
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

  
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME and NUMBER

State Tribal 16-10-54 

2. TYPE OF WORK

DRILL NEW WELL     REENTER P&A WELL     DEEPEN WELL  
3. FIELD OR WILDCAT

BRUNDAGE CANYON  

4. TYPE OF WELL
Oil Well             Coalbed Methane Well: NO 

5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
 

6. NAME OF OPERATOR
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 

7. OPERATOR PHONE
303 999-4044 

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735, Roosevelt, UT, 84066 

9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
kao@bry.com 

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER
(FEDERAL, INDIAN, OR STATE)

14-20-H62-5517 

11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP

FEDERAL    INDIAN    STATE    FEE  
12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP

FEDERAL    INDIAN    STATE    FEE  

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee')
  

14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')

Ute 

18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

YES  (Submit Commingling Application)    NO  

19. SLANT
  

VERTICAL   DIRECTIONAL   HORIZONTAL  

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 474 FSL   658 FEL SESE 10 5.0 S 4.0 W U 

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 474 FSL   658 FEL SESE 10 5.0 S 4.0 W U 

At Total Depth 474 FSL   658 FEL SESE 10 5.0 S 4.0 W U 

21. COUNTY
DUCHESNE  

22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet)
474 

23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
640 

 
 

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL
(Applied For Drilling or Completed)

5000 

26. PROPOSED DEPTH
MD: 6046     TVD: 6046 

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL

6067 

28. BOND NUMBER

RLB0005651 

29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

431723 

ATTACHMENTS
 

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES
 

 WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER  COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY

DRILLED)

TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

NAME Kathy K. Fieldsted TITLE Operations Assistant PHONE 435 722-1325 

SIGNATURE DATE 02/02/2010 EMAIL kkf@bry.com 

API NUMBER ASSIGNED

    43013502450000

    
Permit Manager 

APPROVAL

FORM 3

AMENDED REPORT

API Well No: 43013502450000     Received: 2/2/2010API Well No: 43013502450000 Received: 2/2/2010

FORM 3
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME anSdtaNUMr bEaR16-10-54

2. TYPE OF WORK

DRILL NEW WELL REENTER P&A WELL DEEPEN WELL
3. FIELD OR WILDCRATNDAGE

CANYON

4. TYPE OF WELL 5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
Oil Well Coalbed Methane Well: NO

6. NAME OF OPERATOR 7. OPERATOR PHONE
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 303 999-4044

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735, Roosevelt, UT, 84066 kao@bry.com

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER 11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP 12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
(FEDERAL, INDIAN, 04R2SO 2E)5517

FEDERAL INDIAN STATE FEE FEDERAL INDIAN STATE I FEE I

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME 18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM 19. SLANT

(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

Ute YES I (Submit Commingling Application) NO l' VERTICALI DIRECTIONAL I HORIZONTAL

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 474 FSL 658 FEL SESE 10 5.0 S 4.0 W U

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 474 FSL 658 FEL SESE 10 5.0 S 4.0 W U

At Total Depth 474 FSL 658 FEL SESE 10 5.0 S 4.0 W U

21. COUNTY 22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet) 23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
DUCHESNE 474 640

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL 26. PROPOSED DEPTH
(Applied For Drilling or Completed) MD: 6046 TVD: 6046
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27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL 28. BOND NUMBER 29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

6067 RLBOOO5651 431723

ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

[2 AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

DRILLED)

NAME Kathy K. Fieldsted TITLE Operations Assistant PHONE 435 722-1325

SIGNATURE DATE 02/02/2010 EMAIL kkf@bry.com

API NUMBER ASSIGNED APPROVAL

43013502450000

Permit

API Well No: 43013502450000 Received 2/2/2010

EORM 3
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME anSdtaNUMr bEaR16-10-54

2. TYPE OF WORK 3. FIELD OR WILDCAT
DRILL NEW WELL REENTER P&A WELL DEEPEN WELL BRUNDAGE CANYON

4. TYPE OF WELL 5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
Oil Well Coalbed Methane Well: NO
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10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER 11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP 12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
(FEDERAL, INDIAN, 04R2SO 2E)5517

FEDERAL INDIAN STATE FEE FEDERAL INDIAN STATE I FEE I

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME 18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM 19. SLANT

(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

Ute YES I (Submit Commingling Application) NO l' VERTICALI DIRECTIONAL I HORIZONTAL

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 474 FSL 658 FEL SESE 10 5.0 S 4.0 W U

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 474 FSL 658 FEL SESE 10 5.0 S 4.0 W U

At Total Depth 474 FSL 658 FEL SESE 10 5.0 S 4.0 W U

21. COUNTY 22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet) 23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
DUCHESNE 474 640

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL 26. PROPOSED DEPTH
(Applied For Drilling or Completed) MD: 6046 TVD: 60465000

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL 28. BOND NUMBER 29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE
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ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

[2 AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

DRILLED)

NAME Kathy K. Fieldsted TITLE Operations Assistant PHONE 435 722-1325

SIGNATURE DATE 02/02/2010 EMAIL kkf@bry.com

API NUMBER ASSIGNED APPROVAL

43013502450000

Permit

API Well No: 43013502450000 Received 2/2/2010

EORM 3
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
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BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 303 999-4044

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735, Roosevelt, UT, 84066 kao@bry.com
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Ute YES I (Submit Commingling Application) NO l' VERTICALI DIRECTIONAL I HORIZONTAL
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Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 474 FSL 658 FEL SESE 10 5.0 S 4.0 W U
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VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

[2 AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

DRILLED)
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API NUMBER ASSIGNED APPROVAL

43013502450000

Permit



Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)   

Surf 12.25 8.625 0 300   

Pipe Grade Length Weight    

 Grade J-55 ST&C 300 24.0    

       

API Well No: 43013502450000     Received: 2/2/2010API Well No: 43013502450000 Received: 2/2/2010
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Pipe Grade Length Weight
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API Well No: 43013502450000 Received: 2/2/2010
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API Well No: 43013502450000 Received: 2/2/2010
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Pipe Grade Length Weight
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Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)   

Prod 7.875 5.5 0 3500   

Pipe Grade Length Weight    

 Grade J-55 LT&C 3500 15.5    

       

API Well No: 43013502450000     Received: 2/2/2010API Well No: 43013502450000 Received: 2/2/2010
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API Well No: 43013502450000 Received: 2/2/2010

Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)

Prod 7.875 5.5 0 3500
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’APIWellNo:43013502450000’’APIWellNo:43013502450000’'APIWellNo:43013502450000'

Borry Petroleuna
Conupany am

Renew
Fle1d Name APD BLMRenew

Geoloqic Prognosis BrundageCanyon

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54

county state/Province WSN: SHL:
Duchesne Utah WSN SurfaceLegal Location NISDist (ft) N/S Ref EIW Dist (11) ElW Ref

Ground Elevation (ftKB) OnginalKB Elevation (itKB) 42324 SESE Sec. 10 T5S-R4W 474.0 S 658.0 E
6,067 6,081

Elevation Eslimaled7 Perrnit Status
No Parmii slatus

Working on APD

Fornation Depth @SHL TVD (ftKB) Measured Depth (itKB)

Uinta Fm 0
Green River Fm 1,212
Green River Upper Marker 1,860
Mahogany 2,521
Tgr3 Marker 3,582
Douglas Creek Mbr 4,358
Black Shale Mbr 4,995
1/2 way throughthe objectivesection 5,152
Castle Peak Mbr 5,267

Uteland Butte Mbr 5,730

Wasatch 5,946

TD 6,046

Base of Moderately Saline Water 144

(less than 10,000 ppm)

Core Pro ram9
Type Comment Top (itKB) Otm(ftKB)

Core Program None

Drill Stem Tests
TYPD Comment Top (fiKB) Bim (ftKB}

DST Data None

Mud Logglng
Type Comment Top (ftKB) Stm (ftKB)

Mud Logging None

Logging Program
Type Commani Top (ItKB) Blm(ftKB)

Open Hole Logging Long Guard-SP_GR, Density/Neutron-GR. All logs from TD to base surface casing.

BOP Requirements: 2M SHL Lat Long Survey
Est Days Datum Latitude (DMS) Longitude (DMS)

Estimated Drill Time: 7 Comp Time: 10 days NAD 27 40° 3' 18.89" N 110° 18' 50.62" E

Prepared: "'°anosis |
7/24/2006 |

Comment

Prepared: July, 2008 - (CCC) Formation tops
Revised: August 19, 2008 - (CCC) SHL Survey called in, SHL move, formation tops
REVISED: SEPTEMBER 9,2008 (JLE) NOW PLANNED AS SINGLE PAD VERTICAL WELL.INSTEAD OF DIRECTIONAL. RE-RAN GRIDS FOR TOPS.
NEW SHL.
Revised: September 24, 2008 - (CCC) SHL Survey called in, SHL move, formation tops

AIITVDs are calculated from KB (6081')

Page 1/1 Report Printed:
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BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

STANDARD OPERATING PRACTICES
FOR GREEN RIVER PRODUCING WELLS ONLY

Town Ship's 3S, 4S, 5S, 6S
Range's 4W, 5W, 6W, 7W, SW, 9W

Version: December 7, 2009

DRILLING PROGRAM

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100 & 3160), Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1-7, and the
approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A
copy of these conditions will be furnished to the field representative to ensure compliance.

BLM Notification Requirements

Location Construction: 48 hours prior to construction of location and access roads
including the Ute Tribe Energy and Mineral Department.

Location Completion: Prior to moving the drilling rig.

Spud Notice: At least 24 hours prior to spudding the well.

Casing String and Cementing: 24 hours prior to running casing and cementing all casing
strings.

BOP & Related Equipment Tests: At least 24 hours prior to initiating pressure tests.

First Production Notice: Within 5 days after new well begins or production resumes after
well has been off production for more than 90 days.

Details of the site inspection, including date, time, weather conditions and individuals present will be
submitted with the site specific

'ÀPIWellNo:43013502450000'

BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

STANDARD OPERATING PRACTICES
FOR GREEN RIVER PRODUCING WELLS ONLY

Town Ship's 3S, 4S, 5S, 6S
Range's 4W, 5W, 6W, 7W, SW, 9W

Version: December 7, 2009

DRILLING PROGRAM

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100 & 3160), Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1-7, and the
approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A
copy of these conditions will be furnished to the field representative to ensure compliance.

BLM Notification Requirements

Location Construction: 48 hours prior to construction of location and access roads
including the Ute Tribe Energy and Mineral Department.

Location Completion: Prior to moving the drilling rig.

Spud Notice: At least 24 hours prior to spudding the well.

Casing String and Cementing: 24 hours prior to running casing and cementing all casing
strings.

BOP & Related Equipment Tests: At least 24 hours prior to initiating pressure tests.

First Production Notice: Within 5 days after new well begins or production resumes after
well has been off production for more than 90 days.

Details of the site inspection, including date, time, weather conditions and individuals present will be
submitted with the site specific

'ÀPIWellNo:43013502450000'

BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY
DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH

STANDARD OPERATING PRACTICES
FOR GREEN RIVER PRODUCING WELLS ONLY

Town Ship's 3S, 4S, 5S, 6S
Range's 4W, 5W, 6W, 7W, SW, 9W

Version: December 7, 2009

DRILLING PROGRAM

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100 & 3160), Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1-7, and the
approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A
copy of these conditions will be furnished to the field representative to ensure compliance.

BLM Notification Requirements

Location Construction: 48 hours prior to construction of location and access roads
including the Ute Tribe Energy and Mineral Department.

Location Completion: Prior to moving the drilling rig.

Spud Notice: At least 24 hours prior to spudding the well.

Casing String and Cementing: 24 hours prior to running casing and cementing all casing
strings.

BOP & Related Equipment Tests: At least 24 hours prior to initiating pressure tests.

First Production Notice: Within 5 days after new well begins or production resumes after
well has been off production for more than 90 days.

Details of the site inspection, including date, time, weather conditions and individuals present will be
submitted with the site specific



’APIWellNo:43013502450000’’APIWellNo:43013502450000’'ÃPIWellNo:43013502450000'

Berry Petroleum Company Duchesne County, Utah Drilling Program
December 7, 2009

1. Estimated Tops of Important Geologic Markers:

Formations and depths will be submitted with the site specific APD.
Directional drilling plans will be submitted with the site specific APD.

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil, Gas, Water, and Other Mineral Bearing Zones:

Formations and depths will be submitted with the site specific APD.

All usable (<10,000ppm TDS) water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered duringdrilling will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
recorded and evaluated to determine commercial potential. This information shall be reported tothe BLM Vernal Field Office (BLM/VFO).

Report all water shows and water bearinggeologie units to the geologic/engineering staffof theBLM/VFO prior to running the next string of casing or before plugging orders are requested.
Usage of the State of Utah form Report of Water Encountered is acceptable, but not required.

All water shows must be reported within 1 (one) business day after being encountered.

Detected water flows shall be sampled, analyzed, and reported to the geologic/engineering staff
of the BLM/VFO. The office may request additional water for further analysis.

The following information is requested for water shows and samples where applicable:

Location Date Sampled
Sampled Interval Temperature
Hardness pH
Flow Rate

Water Classification (according to State of Utah)
Dissolved Iron (Fe) (ug/I) Dissolved Calcium (Ca) (mg/l)
Dissolved Magnesium (Mg) (mg/1) Dissolved Sodium (Na) (mg/1)
Dissolved Bicarbonate (NaHCO3)(mg/l) Dissolved Carbonate (COs) (mg/l)
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3. Pressure Control Equipment: (Schematic Attached)

Berry Petroleum Company's minimum specifications for pressure control are as follows:

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas
Order No. 2 for equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc., for a 2M_system when thewell is drilled to the base of the Uteland Butte Liimestone formation, and individual componentsshall be operable as designed. The attached diag,ramdepicts the use of an annular in conjunctionwith double rams. However, an annular, double rams or both may be used depending on thedrilling rig contracted. Chart recorders will be used for all pressure tests.
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Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while drilling
and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

All required BOP tests and/or drills shall be recorded in the IADC report.

The anticipated bottom hole pressure will be less than 3,000 psi.

4. Proposed Casing and Cementing Program:

The proposed Casing Program will be as follows:

Purpose Depth Hole Size Casing Size Type Connection Weight

Surface 300' l2 ¼" 8-5/8" J-55 ST&C or LT&C 24#
Production TD 7-7/8" 5-1/2" J-55 LT&C 15.5#

The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved to protect and/or
isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones, lost circulation zones, abnormally
pressured zones, and any prospectively valuable deposits pf minerals. Any isolating medium
other than cement shall receive approval prior to use. The casing setting depth shall be calculated
to position the casing seat opposite a competent formation, which will contain the maximum
pressure to which it will be exposed during normal drilling operations. Determination of casing
setting depth shall be based on all relevant factors, including: presence/absence of hydrocarbons,
fracture gradients, usable water zones, formation pressures, lost circulation zones, other minerals,
or other unusual characteristics.

All casing, except conductor casing, shall be new or reconòitioned and tested. Used casing shall
meet or exceed API standards for new casing.

The surface casing shall be cemented back to the surface either during the primary cement job or
by remedial cementing. If drive pipe is used, it may be left in place if its total length is less than
twenty feet below the surface. If the total length of the drive pipe is equal to or greater than
twenty feet, it will be pulled prior to cementing, or it will be cemented in place.

As a minimum, usable water zones shall be isolated and/or protected by having a cement top for
the production casing at least 200 feet above the base of usable water or the top of the Upper
Green River Marker ( FOUCH MARKER as observed by Fouch in OC-81), whichever is
shallowest. If gilsonite is encountered while drilling, it shall be isolated and/or protected via the
cementing program. Berry Petroleum Company will report mineral resources such as gilsonite,
tar sands, oil shale, etc to the geologist in the BLM Vernal field office within 5 working days of
each encounter. Each report will include well name/number date and depth of encounter, ( KB or
GL) of encounter, mineral resource encountered, vertical footage of the encounter and , name
and phone number of person making report in case the BLM needs any follow up.

The top of cement will be determined by a Cement Bond Log (CBL). A copy of the CBL, in PDFformat, will be submitted to BLM/VFO. If the cement top does not meet the requirements stated
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above, BLM/VFO will be notified and a decision will be made as to whether remediation is
warranted. If so, a remediation plan will be developed and submitted for approval by BLM/VFO.

Surface casing shall have centralizers on the bottom three joints,with a minimum of one
centralizer per joint.

Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement fluid. A bottom plug
or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush fluid, inner string cement method, etc.,
shall be utilized to help isolate the cement from contamination by the mud being displaced ahead
of the cement slurry.

All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressure tested to 0.22 psi per foot of casing string
length or to 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed 70% of the minimum internal yield.
If pressure declines more than 10% in 30 minutes, corrective action shall be taken.

Casing design will be subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.

The cementing program will be as follows:

Surface Fill Type & Amount

O'-300' 300' Approximately 135 sx Class "G" (Type III) cement +
additives or a similar slurry with a minimum weight of
15.8 ppg and approximate yield of 1.17 ft /sk, minimum
24 hr compressive strength = 500 psi (Cement will be
circulated to surface and toppedoff, if necessary.)

Production with lost circulation Type & Auount

0'-3,500' 11.0 ppg Lead: +/- 219 sacks Premium Lite II Cement + 0.05
lbs/sack Static Free + 3 lbs/sack CSE + 3% bwow
Potassium Chloride + 0.25 lbs/sack Cello Flake + 2
Lbs/sack Kol Seal + 0.002 gps FP-6L + 10% bwoc
Bentonite + 0.5% bwoe Sodium Metasilicate +
201.6% Fresh Water. Slurry Yield 3.82 ft /sk

3,500'-TD 13.0ppg Tail: +/- 296 sacks Pemium Lite II High strength + 0.05
lbs/sack Static Free + 0.4% bwoc
FL-63 + 0.25 lbs/sack Cello Flake + 2 lbs/sack Kol
Seal + 0.002 gps FP-6L + 0.2% bwoe BA-59 +
92% Fresh Water. Slurry Yield 1.92 ft'/sk
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Production without lost circulation Type & Amount

0'- 3500' l1.0 ppg Lead: +/- 219 sacks Premium Lite II Cement + 0.05
lbs/sack Static Free + 3 lbs/sack CSE + 3% bwow
Potassium Chloride + 0.25 lbs/sack Cello Flake + 2
Lbs/sack Kol Seal + 0.002 gps FP-6L + 10% bwoc
Bentonite + 0.5% bwoc Sodium Metasilicate +
201.6% Fresh Water. Slurry Yield 3.82 ft'/sk

3500'- TD 14.3 ppg Tail: +/- 445 sacks ( 50:50) Poz ( Fly Ash) :
Class G Cement + 0.05 lbs/sack Static Free +
3% bwow Potassium Chloride + 0.5% bwoc EC-1 +
0.251bs/sackCello Flake + 0.002 gps FP-6L +
2% bwoc bentinite + 0.3% bwoc Sodium Metasilicate

+ 56.3% Fresh Water. Slurry Yield 1.26 fŸ/sk

For production casing, actual cement volumes will be determined from the caliper log plus aminimum of 20% excess.

For surface casing, waiting on cement (WOC) times will be adequate to achieve 500 psicompressive strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

Anticipated cement tops will be reported as to depth, not the expected number of sacks of cementto be used. The BLM/VFO should be notified, with sufficient lead-time, in order to have aBLM/VFO representative on location while running all casing strings and cementing.

After cementing the surfàce pipe and/or any intermediate strings, but before commencing anytest, the casing string shall stand cemented until the cement has reached a compressive strength ofat least 500 psi at the shoe. WOC time shall be recorded in the Driller's Log.

The following reports shall be filed with the BLM/VFO within 30 days after the work is
completed:

Progress reports, Form 3160-5, "Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells," must include thefollowing information:
Setting of each string showing the size; grade; weight of casing set; setting depth;
amounts and types of cement used; whether the cement circulated or the top of the
cement behind the casing; depth of the cementing tools used; casing testing method andresults; and the date of the work done. Spud date will be shown on thefirstreports
submitted.

Auxiliary well control equipment to be used as follows:

An upper Kelly Cock will be kept in the string at all times.

A float may be used in the drill string.

A stabbing valve will be available on the rig floor and will fit all rotary connections.
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A minimum two inch (2") choke manifold and pit level indicator.

5. Drilling Fluids Program:

Interval Weight Viscosity Fluid Loss Remarks

0'-300' 8.3-8.6 27-40 NC Spud Mud or air
300'-TD 8.6-8.9 27-40 NC KCI Water

Drilling fluids will be processed using either a closed loop system to process drilled solids or alined reserve pit. And will be noted with a submitted site specifies APD.
No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and/or Indian lands without
prior approval from the BLM to ensure adequate protection of fresh aquifers.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title III in an amount equal to or greater than
10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association
with the drilling, testing, or completing of any wells. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous
substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, produced,
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5.1 Air Drilling Operations

From surface to ±350 feet will be drilled with air or air mist. The air rig is equipped with
6 ½" blooie line that is straight run and securely anchored. The blooie line is used with a
discharge less than 100 ft from the wellbore in order to minimize the well pad size. The
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compressor is located less than 100 ft from the well bore due to the low possibility of
combustion with the air dust mixture. The trailer mounted compressor (capacity of 900
CFM). With a secondary air compressor ( capacity of 1150 CFM ). A truck with 70 bbls
of water will be on stand by to be used as kill fluid, if necessary.

5.2 Variances

Berry Petroleum Company requests a variance from Onshore Order 2, III.E.1. which
states, "...the following equipment shall be in place and operational during air/gas
drilling: (1) Properly lubricated and maintained rotating head ...(2) Blooie line discharge100 feet from well bore...(3) Automatic igniter or continuous pilot light on the blooieline... (4) compressors located...a minimum of 100 ft from the well bore..."
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5.2.1
Berry Petroleum Company request permission to use a diverter bowl in place of a rotating
head. The diverter bowl forces the air and cutting returns to the reserve pit and is used to
drill the surface casing (surface to a total depth of +-350 feet). The surface casing occurs
within the Uinta Formation which is a non-hydrocarbon bearing zone and thus has no
possibility of gas pressure.

5.2.2
Berry Petroleum Company request permission to use a blooieline with a discharge lessthan 100 feet from the wellbore in order to minimize the size of the well pads and directthe cuttings and circulating mediums into the cuttings or reserve pit. The requested lengthof the blooie line to drill the surface casing (surface to a total depth of +-350 feet) is 50feet. The surface casing occurs within the Uinta Formation which is a non-hydrocarbon
bearing zone and thus has no possibility of gas pressure.

5.2.3
Berry Petroleum Company request permission to operate without an automatic igniter or
continuous pilot light on the blooie line due to the fact the air rig is only used to drill the
surface casing (surface to a total depth of +-350 feet). The surface casing occurs withinthe Uinta Formation which is a non-hydrocarbon bearing zone and thus has no possibility
of gas pressure.

5.2.4
Berry Petroleum Company request permission to use a trailermounted compressor
located less than 100 feet from the well bore in order to minimize the well pad size. The
trailer mounted compressor is located 50 feet from the wellbore and in an opposite
direction of the blooie line. The compressor has the following safety features: (1) shut
off valve on the trailer that is located approximately 15 ft from the air rig, (2) pressure
relief valve on the compressor, and (3) Spark arresters on the motors. The compressor
only used in the drilling of the surface casing (surface to a total depth of +-350 feet). The
surface casing occurs within the Uinta Formation which is a non-hydrocarbon bearing
zone and thus has no possibility of gas pressure.

6. Evaluation Program:

Logging Program: HRI-SP with SDL-DSN; surface casing to TD. GR log will be
run back to surface. Preserve samples from all show intervals.
CBL will be run after production cementing.

Surveys: Every 500' on straight wells and as needed on directionals

Mud Logger: As deemed necessary

Drill Stem Tests: As deemed necessary.
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Cores: As deemed necessary.

Samples (dry cut): As deemed necessary

A complete set of angular deviation and directional surveys of a directional well will besubmitted to the Vernal BLM office engineer within 30 days of the completion of the well.
The Evaluation Program may change at the discretion of the well site geologist with an approvalby the BLM/VFO Authorized Officer.

When utilized, mud or lithology logs will be submitted to the BLM/VFO.

Drill stem tests, if they are run, will adhere to the following requirements:

Initial opening of the drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours unlessspecific approval to start during other hours is obtained from the Authorized Officer.However, DST's may be allowed to continue at night if the test was initiated duringdaylight hours and the rate of flow is stabilized and if adequate lighting is available (i.e.,lighting which is adequate for visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers canbe released, but tripping shall not beginbefore daylight, unless prior approval is obtainedfrom the Authorized Officer. Closed chamber DST's may be performed day or night.

Some means of reverse circulation shall be provided in case of flow to the surfàceshowing evidence of hydrocarbons.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly installedbefore a test.starts.

If a drill stem test is performed, all engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that arerequired to be operational during the test shall have spark arresters or water-cooled
exhausts.

Daily drilling reports shall be submitted to the BLM/VFO after drilling operations arecompleted for each well, and daily completion records shall be submitted with thecompletion report of each well.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or a producer, the "Well Completion andRecompletion Report and Log"(Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30 days aftercompletion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43CFR 3164. One copy of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well test data, geologicsummaries, sample descriptions, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled during thedrilling, workover, and/or completion operations will be filed with Form 3160-4. Samples(cuttings, fluids, and/or gases) if collected, will be submitted when requested by the BLM/VFO.
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7. Abnormal Conditions:

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No hydrogen sulfide has been
encountered or is known to exist from previous drilling in the area at this depth. Maximum
anticipated bottomhole pressure will be approximately equal to totaldepth in feet multiplied by a
0.43 psi/foot gradient, and maximum anticipated surface pressure will be approximately equal to
bottomhole pressure minus the pressure of a partially evacuated hole calculated at 0.22 psilfoot.
These pressures will be expressed in psi in each site specific APD.
Bottom hole pressures will be report to BLM on completion report.

8. Anticipated Starting Dates and Notification of Operations:

Drilling Activity:

Anticipated Commencement Date: Upon approval of the site specific APD.
Drilling Days: Approximately 6 days.
Completion Days: Approximately 7 days.

Notification of Operations:

The BLM/VFO will be notified at least 24 hours prior to the commencement of spudding
the well (to be followed with a Sundry Notice, Form 3160-5), of initiating pressure tests
of the blowout preventer and related equipment, and running casing and cementing all
casing strings. Notification will be made during regular work hours (7:45 a.m. - 4:30
p.m., Monday-Friday except holidays).

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or
workover equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in suspended status
without prior approval from theBLM/VFO Authorized Officer. If operations are to be
suspended, prior approval of the BLM/VFO Authorized Officer will be obtained and
notification given before resumption of operations.

A completion rig will be used for completion operations. All conditions of this approved
plan will be applicable during all operations conducted with the completion rig.

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual
occurrences shall be promptly reported in accordance with the requirements of NTL-3A
or its revision.

The date on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for oil wellsas the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporarystorage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated,
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or the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent storage
facility, whichever occurs first; and for gas wells, as the date on which associated liquid
hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporary storage facility, such as a test
tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated, or the date on which gas is
measured through permanent metering facilities, whichever occurs first.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLM/VFO Authorized
Officer will be notified when the well is placed in a producing status. Such notification
will be sent by written communication not later than 5 days following the date when the
well is placed on production.

Pursuant to Onshore Order No. 7, with the approval of the BLM/VFO AuthorizedOfficer, produced water may be temporarily disposed of into lined pits for a period of upto 90 days, unless tankage is in place. During this period, an application for approval ofthe permanent disposal method must be submitted to the BLM/VFO Authorized Officer.

Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare gas during theinitial well evaluation tests, not to exceed 30 days or the first production of 50 MMCF ofgas, whichever occurs first. An application must be filed with the BLM/VFO AuthorizedOfficer and approval received for any venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial 30 days or
authorized test period.

A schematic facilities diagram, as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5(b.9.d), shall be
submitted to the BLM/VFO Authorized Officer within 60 days of installation or first
production, whichever occurs first. All site security regulations, as specified in Onshore
Oil and Gas Order No. 3, shall be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving
hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-
5(b.4).

Well abandonment operations shall not be commenced without the prior approval of the
BLM/VFO Authorized Officer. In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in
emergency situations, oral approval will be obtained from the BLM/VFO Authorized
Officer. And followed up in writing on Form 3160-5 within 5 working days of verbal
approval A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment," Form 3160-5, will be filed with the
BLM/VFO Authorized Officer within 30 days following completion of the well for
abandonment. This report will indicate placement of the plugs and current status of the
surface restoration. Final Abandonment will not be approved until the surface
reclamation work required by the approved APD or approved abandonment notice hasbeen completed to the satisfaction of the BLM/VFO Authorized Officer or representative,
or the appropriate surface managing agency.

Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, lessees and operators have the
responsibility to see that their exploration, de'velopment,production, and constructionoperations are conducted in a manner which conforms with applicable Federal laws andregulations and with the State and local laws, to the extent to which they are applicable,to operations on Federal or Indian Lands.
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emergency situations, oral approval will be obtained from the BLM/VFO Authorized
Officer. And followed up in writing on Form 3160-5 within 5 working days of verbal
approval A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment," Form 3160-5, will be filed with the
BLM/VFO Authorized Officer within 30 days following completion of the well for
abandonment. This report will indicate placement of the plugs and current status of the
surface restoration. Final Abandonment will not be approved until the surface
reclamation work required by the approved APD or approved abandonment notice hasbeen completed to the satisfaction of the BLM/VFO Authorized Officer or representative,
or the appropriate surface managing agency.

Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, lessees and operators have the
responsibility to see that their exploration, de'velopment,production, and constructionoperations are conducted in a manner which conforms with applicable Federal laws andregulations and with the State and local laws, to the extent to which they are applicable,to operations on Federal or Indian Lands.
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9. Other information:

For new locations and as existing locations are maintained, all loading lines will be placed inside
the berm surrounding the tank battery.

AII off lease storage, off lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease will have prior
approval from the BLM/VFO Authorized Officer.

The gas meter will be calibrated and any production tank will be strapped in place prior to anydeliveries. Tests for meter accuracy will be conducted monthly following initial installation forthree months and at least quarterly thereaner. The BLM/VFO Authorized Officer will beprovided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all future meter proving
schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be submitted to the BLM/VFO. All
measurement facilities will conform to API and AGA standards, Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 4,and Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas and liquid hydrocarbon measurements.

The use of materials under BLM jurisdictionwill conform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

Deviations from the proposed drilling and/or workover program shall be approved by the
BLM/VFO Authorized Officer. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. All
wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, will be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.

"Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (form 3160-5) will be filed for approval for all changes of
plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982, as implemented
by the applicable provisions of the operating regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-l(c), requires
that "not later than the 5* business day after any well begins production on which royalty is due
anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site, resumes production in the case of a well
which has been off production for more than90 days, the operator shall notify the Authorized
Officer by letter or sundry notice, Form 3160-5, or orally, to be followed by a letter or sundry
notice, of the date on which such production has begun or resumed."

APD approval is valid for a period of two years from the signature date. An extension period
may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.

Any changes from this SOP will be changed with a sundry notice or sent in site specific with the
APD.
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Contact numbers
Berry Petroleum Company

Berry Petroleum Company Denver 303-999-4400

Berry Petroleum Company Roosevelt 435-722-1325

Fred Goodrich Production Sup. Office 435-722-1325

TBD Completion Sup. Office 435-722-1325

TBD Drilling Sup. Office 435-722-1325

Contact Numbers
BLM

Carey Doyle Engineer Office 435-781-3406
Cell 435-828-7874

Ryan Angus Engineering Office 435-781-4432
Cell 435-828-7368

Michael Lee Engineering Office 435-781-4432
Cell 435-828-7875

Jamie Sparger Inspection & Enforcement Office 435-781-4502
Cell 435-828-3913

Bill Owens Inspection & Enforcement Office 435-781-4498
Cell 435-828-7630
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BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY
STATE TRIBAL #16-10-54

LOCATED IN DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 10, TSS, R4W, U.S.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKES CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHEASTERLY
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BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY
TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR

X-section STATE TRIBAL #16-10-54
Il scale SECTION 10, T5S, R4W, U.S.B.&M.

L
1" = 50'

474' FSL 658' FEL "It,

DATE: 11--14-08 40 100'
DRAWN BY: D.P.

STA J+00

10' 70' 40' 100'

LOCA7/0N STAKE

-- cor STA 1+50

10' 70 40' 100

Finished Grade
Slope = 1 1 2:1

cur , STA 0+50
Preconstruction Il I
Grade 140 100

STA 0+00
APPROX/MA7E ACREAGES

NOTE. WELLS/TE D/STURBANCE = ± 1.993 ACRES
ACCESS ROAD O/STURBANCE = ± 1.16J ACRES ' --

ITopsoil should not be P/PEL/NE O/STURBANCE = ± 1.172 ACRES
Stripped Below Finished * NO7E
Grade on Substructure Area. 70TAL = ± 4.J28 ACRES F/LL QUANT/TY/NCLUDES

5% FOR COMPACTION

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = J,070 Cu. Yds.

CUT Topsoil & Pit Backfill = J,070 Cu. Yds.
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,J80 Cu. Yds (1/2 Pit Vol.)
Rernaining Location = 8,260 Cu. Yds. EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 9,640 CU. YDS. (After Interirn Rehabilitation)

FILL = 6,570 CU. YDS U NTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utrzh, 84078 * (435)
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TYPICAL RIG LAYOUT

STATE TRIBAL #16-10-54 piturgy
SECTION 10, T5S, R4W, U.S.B.&M. #,0 L^ND e.??
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'No 16131
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BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY
TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR m

x-section STATE TRIBAL //16-10-54 LAND

scale SECTION 10, T5S, R4W, U.S.B.&M. No. 16131c g
474' FSL 658' FEL - o-

1" =
50°

DDARAN01-06-1 40' 100

STA J+00

110 100'

I
LOCA T/ON STAKE

I Ill¯¯\\ IIEl1Elli II IElll BIE¯llE¯\l' ' I-t

STA 1+50

STA 0+50
Preconstruction
Grode 110' 100

- CUT
i I i=i i I=I I--Mirili=lii¯

E/LL

STA 0+00 '

APPROX/MA TE ACREAGES \
NOTE: WELL S/TE O/STURBANCE = ± 1.993 ACRES

ACCESS ROAD DISTURBANCE = ± 7 16J ACRES

ITopsoil should not be P/PEL/NE DISTURBANCE = ± 1.172 ACRES
Stripped Below Finished * NOTE
Grade on Substructure Area- TOTAL = ± 4.328 ACRES F/LL OUANT/TY INCLUDES

5% EOR COMPACT/ON

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = 1,280 Cu. Yds.

CUT Topsoil = 1,280 Cu. Yds.
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 7,280 Cu. Yds.
Rernaining Location = 5, 160 Cu. Yds.

EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 6,440 CU. YDS. (After Interim Rehabilitation)

UINTAH ENCINEERINc & LAND SURVEYING
FILL = 5, 160 CU. YDS BS So 200 East * Vemal. Utah 84078 * (436)
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T6S, R4 W, U.S. B.&M. BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY
Well location, STATE TRIBAL#16-10-54, located

S89°52'W
- 5280.00' (G.L.O.) as shown in the SE 1/4 SE 1/4 of Section 10,

T5S, R4W, U.S.B.&M., Duchesne County, Utah.
Set Sime,
Rebar BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK (M67) LOCATEDIN THE SW 1/4 OF SECTION
9, T5S, R4W, U.S.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE DUCHESNE
COUNTY,7.5 MINUTEQUAD. (TOPOGRAPHICMAP) PUBLISHED
BY THE UNITEDSTATES DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR,
GEOLOGICALSURVEY.SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKEDON THE
CAP AS BEING6097 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGSIS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

- 10 I

CSERCAFICLATE

THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE ABOVEPL ROM
S7A 1E 7R/BAL/16-10-54 FIELDNOTESOF ACTUALSURYEYSMA

SUPERVISIONAND THATTHE SAMEA CORR E
v. Ungraded Ground = 6067' BEST OF MYKNOWLEDGEAND

A N 19
SBB4J'58"W ·- 5297.71' (Meas.) sygy

N

UINTAH ENGINEERING & t G
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL UTAH 84078

(435) 789--1017
LEGEND:

NAO 63 (SURFACE LOCATION) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRÀWN:

=
90° SYMBOL LAT1TUDE- 40'03'18.75" (40.055208) 1" = 1000' 11-12-08 11-14-08

LONGITUDE - 11018'53.17" (110.314769) PARTY REFERENCES
= PROPOSED WELL HEAD· NAD 27 (SURFACEI.0CATION) S.H. T.P. D.P. G.L.O. PLAT

A = SECTIONCORNERS LOCATED. LATITUDE - 40'03'18.89" (40.055247) MATHER FILE
LONGITUDE= 11018'50.62" (110.314061) OÛ I- BERRY PETROLEUM
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SURFACE DAMAGEAND RIGHT-OF-WAY SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS, THAT•

WHEREAS, Sportsmen fordabitnHue, whose address is 626 Cottonwood Drive, South Weber,
UT 84405 (hereinañer referred to as GRANTOR,whether one or more), is the owner of the surface of the
following described property located in DuchesneCounty,Utah, to-wit:

SFW TRIBAL 9-10D-54 & SFW 10-10D-54

TOWNSHIP 5 SOUTH, RANGE 4 WEST, USB &M Ent 417450 EkÞi335 Þ¡ 638Section 10: NWSWl/4, SWSEl/4 Date: 04-AUG-2009 2:19PM
Fee: $21.00 Check
Filed By: CBMSFW FEE 15-10-54
CAROLYNE MADSEN, Recorder
DUCHESNECOUNTYCORPORATIONTOWNSHIP 5 SOUTH, RANGE 4 WEST, USB &M For: BERRYPETROLEUMCO

Section 10: SWSEl/4

ACCESS ROAD and PIPELINE to STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54

TOWNSHIP 5 SOUTH, RANGE 4 WEST, USB &M
Section 10: SWSEl/4

See Exhibit: Attached

and Berry Petroleum Company, whose address is 1999 Broadway, Suite 3700, Denver, CO, 80202
(hereinafter referred to as GRANTEE), owns leases covering oil, gas and mineral rights in, under and upon
said property; and

WHEREAS, Grantee desires to construct and maintain an access road and a pipeline or pipelines
and appurtenances thereto on a portion of said property.

NOW THEREFORE, for an in consideration of the sum of ten dollars (510.00) and other
valuable considerations, the receipt and sufficiencyof which is hereby acknowledged, Gramor does hereby
gram, sell and convey unto Grantee, its successors and assigns, the easementand right to use that portion of
the herein above described property as may be necessary to construci, entrench, maintain, operate, replace,
remove, proteci, or abandon a pipeline or pipelines for water or gas with appurtenancesthereto, including,
but not limited to, valves, metering equipment, and cathodie equipment; to construct, mainlain, relocate, or
abandon a road (said pipelines, appunenance, valves, metering equipment, cathodic equipmem and road
being sometimescollectively call the "facilities") over, under, andthrough the hereinalter described land as
described in the atlached Exhibits.

Grantor acknowledgesthe receipt and sufficiencyof the above described consideration as paymem
for all damages to Grantor's trees, timber, growing crops, and other vegetation beingcuhivated en said land
by the undersigned or their respective lessees, tenants or assigns caused by the construction, maintenance,protection, repair, replacememor removal of the facilitiesas described in the attached exhibits and agrees
that the payment and acceptance of uie consideration set forth above is in filll and complete payment,
settlement, compromise and satisfaction of any and all of the above-mentioned losses, liabilities, claims,
damages, demands and causes of action for any and all injuries and damage to the surface of the land
hereinbelow described and to any appurtenances or improvements cliereon,and for any and all claims
including but not limitedto Jossof potential rental income,damages to and/or lossof livestockand wildlife,
arising directly or indirectly in connection with the operations thereon by Grantee, its employees, agents,
contractors, or subcontractors incormeetionwith the above-mentionedoperations of Gramee.

Grantee shall have the free right of ingressand egress to, over, upon, through and across said right-
of-way and casemem for any and all purposes that may be necessary or incidental to the maimenanceof theright-of-way and easement, with the right to use existing roads which enter Grantor's property for thepurpose of constructing, inspecting,repairing and maintaining the facilities and the removal or replacement
of same at will, either in whole or in part, and the replacementof said pîpeline or pipelines with either likeor different size pipe. During temporaryperiods, Grantee may use such portions of the property along andadjacent to said right-of-wayas may be necessary in connection with constniction, maintenance, repair,removal or replacement of the facilitiesand if such use cause any damages to Grantor's lands outside
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Grantor acknowledgesthe receipt and sufficiencyof the above described consideration as paymem
for all damages to Grantor's trees, timber, growing crops, and other vegetation beingcuhivated en said land
by the undersigned or their respective lessees, tenants or assigns caused by the construction, maintenance,protection, repair, replacememor removal of the facilitiesas described in the attached exhibits and agrees
that the payment and acceptance of uie consideration set forth above is in filll and complete payment,
settlement, compromise and satisfaction of any and all of the above-mentioned losses, liabilities, claims,
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including but not limitedto Jossof potential rental income,damages to and/or lossof livestockand wildlife,
arising directly or indirectly in connection with the operations thereon by Grantee, its employees, agents,
contractors, or subcontractors incormeetionwith the above-mentionedoperations of Gramee.
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approval from Grantor in writing, Grantor's approval not to be unreasonably withheld, and after receipt of
such approval, may proceed to cut and remove such trees subject to payment of additional timber damages,
if any are deterrnined.

The undersigned Grantor hereby covenants and warrants that he is the surface owner of the above-
described land, and has the right to enter into this Agreement.

FOR THE SAME CONSIDERATION RECITED ABOVE, Grantor and Grantee do hereby
release, discharge and acquit the other from any and all liability, and shall indemnifythe other against any
and all claims and demands for damages, attorneys fees, injury or loss, existing now or done hereafter, to
the surface of said lands or to any third parties arising out of or being the result of their or, their agents,
contractors, licensees, permittees, successors and assigns own activities on or use of the subject propetty.
However, such parties' potential liability under this paragraph to the other shall be limitedto the acts and/or
omission of it, or its predecessors, agents, contractors, licensees, permittees, successors, and assigns, and
shall not include any acts and/or omissions of the other party, its agents, contractors, licensees,permittees,
successors or assigns. Grantee shaH reasonably maintain the subject property in order to prevent
unnecessary deterioration ofthe surface and to keep the property in an unlittered condition.

TO HAVE AND TO HOLD the above described rights and easements, together with all rights
necessary to operate and maintain the facilities over the right-of-wayhereby granted unto the said Grantee,
its successors and assigns, until such time as the right-of-way and easement is abandoned under the terms
stipulated herein. The Grantee may assign the rights and easements herein granted, either in whole or in
part, subject to the terms of this grant, and such fights and easements shall be covenants running with the
land and be binding up Grantor, Grantor's heirs, legal representatives and successors in title. Upon
abandonment, at the request of the Grantor, Grantee shall execute and deliver to Grantor a document in
recordable form evidencing said abandonment. Also, upon abandonment, at the request of the Grantor,
Grantee shall restore the surface used under the terms of this Agreement to as near its original condition as
is possible.

The making, execution and delivery of this document by Grantor has been induced by no
representations, statements, warranties, or other agreements other than those herein expressed. This
agreement embodies the entire understanding of the parties, and this instrument may be amended or
modified only by subsequent written agreement of the parties.

Grantee shall maintain all roads used pursuant to this Agreement and shall install cuiverts where
necessary to in sure adequate drainage from all roads. Grantee shall also install cattle guards where the
roads go thru fences, if any.

This agreement shall inure to the benefit of the parties hereto, their heirs, successors, and assigns
and shall be a burden running with the land.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this Surface Damage and Right-of-Way
SettlementAgreement effective as of the day of , 2009.

G BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY

STATE OF UTAH )
COUNTYOF )
BEFORE ME, the undersigned, a Notary Public, in and for said County and Stat his O da

, 2009, personally appeared Sportsmen for . t¾o (
identical person(s) described in and who executed the within and foregoing instrument of writing and
acknowledged to me that he duly executed the same as hisfree and voluntary act and deed for the purposes
therein set forth.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF. I have hereunto set mv hand and affixed mv notarial meni the ano una v..r
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August 4, 2009

To Whom It May Concern:

Please be advised that the undersigned, Sportsmen for Fish and Wildlife Inc., as owner of
the Surface Estate of the SEl/4 of Section 10, Township 5 South, Range 4 West,
USB&M Duchesne County, Utah, do hereby waive the requirement to have an
archeological survey conducted on the location and right-of-way to be constructed across
the aforesaid land.

Sportsmen for Fish and
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ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

Operator BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 

Well Name State Tribal 16-10-54

API Number 43013502450000 APD No 2333 Field/Unit BRUNDAGE CANYON 

Location: 1/4,1/4 SESE       Sec  10   Tw  5.0S    Rng  4.0W    474   FSL   658   FEL

GPS Coord (UTM)   Surface Owner
 

Participants

Floyd Bartlett (DOGM), Jeff Crozier, Fred Goodrich (Berry Petroleum Company), Ben Williams , Alex Hansen

(UDWR), Charles MacDonald (BLM)
 

Regional/Local Setting & Topography

The well site is proposed approximately 18.8 miles +/- south of Myton, Utah along Sowers Canyon Road to the

Brundage Canyon road, then south 0.6 miles then east and north 0.35 miles to the pad of the State Tribal

1&2-15-54 producing oil wells. From this location 0.3 miles of new road will be constructed in a northeasterly

direction to the site. 

The general topography is canyon bottoms with steep sidewalls and side drainages. 

Brundage Canyon is to the west and Sowers Canyon to the north. Both have broad bottoms with numerous small

side drainages forming alluvial fans as they reach the canyon bottoms. Brundage Canyon runs in a northeasterly

direction to its confluence with Sowers Canyon. Sowers Canyon contains a perennial stream, which flows easterly

into Antelope Creek. Antelope Creek flows in a northerly direction to the Duchesne River. 

The proposed State Tribal 16-10-54 oil well is on a bench on the north slope of a hillside or end of a ridge. This

ridge extends to the south and becomes Brundage Ridge. To the north it breaks off into a steep canyon that

continues to the wide bottom of Sowers Canyon. The steam in Sowers Canyon is about ½ mile to the north. The pad

is oriented in an east to west direction along the bench. Three small swales intersect the proposed pad running in a

northerly direction and will be filled. Two of these begin with the location. A diversion is planned around the south

side of the disturbed area, diverting the minimal overland flows both to the east and west. Both Location corners 2

and 8 will be rounded to avoid excessive fill in these steeper areas. Berry plans to drill the well using a closed loop

mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for berming the tanks or will be spread on the location. The

site appears to be an acceptable location for construction of a pad, drilling and operating the well. It is the only

suitable site in the immediate area. 

The Utah Division of Wildlife Resources owns the surface for this location and the minerals are owned by the US

Government and held in trust for the Ute Indian Tribe.
 

Surface Use Plan

Current Surface Use

Grazing

Recreational

Wildlfe Habitat

Deer Winter Range
 

New Road Miles Well Pad Src Const Material Surface Formation

0.3 Width 200   Length 310 Onsite UNTA
 

Ancillary Facilities  N
 

Waste Management Plan Adequate?
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ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Operator BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY
Well Name State Tribal 16-10-54

API Number 43013502450000 APD No 2333 Field/Unit BRUNDAGE CANYON
Location: 1/4,1/4 SESE Sec 10 Tw 5.0S Rng 4.0W 474 FSL 658 FEL
GPS Coord (UTM) Surface Owner

Participants
Floyd Bartlett (DOGM), Jeff Crozier, Fred Goodrich (Berry Petroleum Company), Ben Williams , Alex Hansen
(UDWR), Charles MacDonald (BLM)

Regional/Local Setting & Topography
The well site is proposed approximately 18.8 miles +/- south of Myton, Utah along Sowers Canyon Road to the
Brundage Canyon road, then south 0.6 miles then east and north 0.35 miles to the pad of the State Tribal
l&2-15-54 producing oil wells. From this location 0.3 miles of new road will be constructed in a northeasterly
direction to the site.
The general topography is canyon bottoms with steep sidewalls and side drainages.
Brundage Canyon is to the west and Sowers Canyon to the north. Both have broad bottoms with numerous small
side drainages forming alluvial fans as they reach the canyon bottoms. Brundage Canyon runs in a northeasterly
direction to its confluence with Sowers Canyon. Sowers Canyon contains a perennial stream, which flows easterly
into Antelope Creek. Antelope Creek flows in a northerly direction to the Duchesne River.

The proposed State Tribal 16-10-54 oil well is on a bench on the north slope of a hillside or end of a ridge. This
ridge extends to the south and becomes Brundage Ridge. To the north it breaks off into a steep canyon that
continues to the wide bottom of Sowers Canyon. The steam in Sowers Canyon is about ½ mile to the north. The pad
is oriented in an east to west direction along the bench. Three small swales intersect the proposed pad running in a
northerly direction and will be filled. Two of these begin with the location. A diversion is planned around the south
side of the disturbed area, diverting the minimal overland flows both to the east and west. Both Location corners 2
and 8 will be rounded to avoid excessive fill in these steeper areas. Berry plans to drill the well using a closed loop
mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for berming the tanks or will be spread on the location. The
site appears to be an acceptable location for construction of a pad, drilling and operating the well. It is the only
suitable site in the immediate area.

The Utah Division of Wildlife Resources owns the surface for this location and the minerals are owned by the US
Government and held in trust for the Ute Indian Tribe.

Surface Use Plan
Current Surface Use
Grazing
Recreational
Wildlfe Habitat
Deer Winter Range

New Road Miles Well Pad Src Const Material Surface Formation
0.3 Width 200 Length 310 Onsite UNTA

Ancillary Facilities N

Waste Management Plan Adequate?
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ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Operator BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY
Well Name State Tribal 16-10-54

API Number 43013502450000 APD No 2333 Field/Unit BRUNDAGE CANYON
Location: 1/4,1/4 SESE Sec 10 Tw 5.0S Rng 4.0W 474 FSL 658 FEL
GPS Coord (UTM) Surface Owner

Participants
Floyd Bartlett (DOGM), Jeff Crozier, Fred Goodrich (Berry Petroleum Company), Ben Williams , Alex Hansen
(UDWR), Charles MacDonald (BLM)

Regional/Local Setting & Topography
The well site is proposed approximately 18.8 miles +/- south of Myton, Utah along Sowers Canyon Road to the
Brundage Canyon road, then south 0.6 miles then east and north 0.35 miles to the pad of the State Tribal
l&2-15-54 producing oil wells. From this location 0.3 miles of new road will be constructed in a northeasterly
direction to the site.
The general topography is canyon bottoms with steep sidewalls and side drainages.
Brundage Canyon is to the west and Sowers Canyon to the north. Both have broad bottoms with numerous small
side drainages forming alluvial fans as they reach the canyon bottoms. Brundage Canyon runs in a northeasterly
direction to its confluence with Sowers Canyon. Sowers Canyon contains a perennial stream, which flows easterly
into Antelope Creek. Antelope Creek flows in a northerly direction to the Duchesne River.

The proposed State Tribal 16-10-54 oil well is on a bench on the north slope of a hillside or end of a ridge. This
ridge extends to the south and becomes Brundage Ridge. To the north it breaks off into a steep canyon that
continues to the wide bottom of Sowers Canyon. The steam in Sowers Canyon is about ½ mile to the north. The pad
is oriented in an east to west direction along the bench. Three small swales intersect the proposed pad running in a
northerly direction and will be filled. Two of these begin with the location. A diversion is planned around the south
side of the disturbed area, diverting the minimal overland flows both to the east and west. Both Location corners 2
and 8 will be rounded to avoid excessive fill in these steeper areas. Berry plans to drill the well using a closed loop
mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for berming the tanks or will be spread on the location. The
site appears to be an acceptable location for construction of a pad, drilling and operating the well. It is the only
suitable site in the immediate area.

The Utah Division of Wildlife Resources owns the surface for this location and the minerals are owned by the US
Government and held in trust for the Ute Indian Tribe.
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l&2-15-54 producing oil wells. From this location 0.3 miles of new road will be constructed in a northeasterly
direction to the site.
The general topography is canyon bottoms with steep sidewalls and side drainages.
Brundage Canyon is to the west and Sowers Canyon to the north. Both have broad bottoms with numerous small
side drainages forming alluvial fans as they reach the canyon bottoms. Brundage Canyon runs in a northeasterly
direction to its confluence with Sowers Canyon. Sowers Canyon contains a perennial stream, which flows easterly
into Antelope Creek. Antelope Creek flows in a northerly direction to the Duchesne River.
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ridge extends to the south and becomes Brundage Ridge. To the north it breaks off into a steep canyon that
continues to the wide bottom of Sowers Canyon. The steam in Sowers Canyon is about ½ mile to the north. The pad
is oriented in an east to west direction along the bench. Three small swales intersect the proposed pad running in a
northerly direction and will be filled. Two of these begin with the location. A diversion is planned around the south
side of the disturbed area, diverting the minimal overland flows both to the east and west. Both Location corners 2
and 8 will be rounded to avoid excessive fill in these steeper areas. Berry plans to drill the well using a closed loop
mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for berming the tanks or will be spread on the location. The
site appears to be an acceptable location for construction of a pad, drilling and operating the well. It is the only
suitable site in the immediate area.

The Utah Division of Wildlife Resources owns the surface for this location and the minerals are owned by the US
Government and held in trust for the Ute Indian Tribe.
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Environmental Parameters

Affected Floodplains and/or Wetlands  N
 

Flora / Fauna

Pinion/Juniper habitat type. The area was covered with about 6 inches of snow. Identified plants included

Pinion, juniper, black sage brush, slender wheatgrass, yucca.

Mountain lion, bobcat, rabbit, coyote and smaller birds and mammals.
 

Soil Type and Characteristics

Moderately deep gravely sandy clay loam.
 

Erosion Issues  N
 

Sedimentation Issues  N
 

Site Stability Issues  N
 

Drainage Diverson Required?  Y

A diversion is planned around the south side of the disturbed area, diverting the minimal overland flows both

to the east and west.
 

Berm Required?  N
 

Erosion Sedimentation Control Required?  N
 

Paleo Survey Run?  N     Paleo Potental Observed?  N     Cultural Survey Run?  Y     Cultural Resources?  
 

Reserve Pit
 

Site-Specific Factors Site Ranking  

Distance to Groundwater (feet)

Distance to Surface Water (feet)

Dist. Nearest Municipal Well (ft)

Distance to Other Wells (feet)

Native Soil Type

Fluid Type

Drill Cuttings

Annual Precipitation (inches)

Affected Populations

Presence Nearby Utility Conduits

 

Final Score  Sensitivity Level
 

Characteristics / Requirements

Berry plans to drill the well using a closed loop mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for

berming the tanks or will be spread on the location.
 

Closed Loop Mud Required? Y   Liner Required?    Liner Thickness    Pit Underlayment Required?  
 

Other Observations / Comments
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Environmental Parameters
Affected Floodplains and/or Wetlands N

Flora / Fauna
Pinion/Juniper habitat type. The area was covered with about 6 inches of snow. Identified plants included
Pinion, juniper,black sage brush, slender wheatgrass, yucca.

Mountain lion, bobcat, rabbit, coyote and smaller birds and mammals.

Soil Type and Characteristics
Moderately deep gravely sandy clay loam.

Erosion Issues N

Sedimentation Issues N

Site Stability Issues N

Drainage Diverson Required? Y
A diversion is planned around the south side of the disturbed area, diverting the minimal overland flows both
to the east and west.

Berm Required? N

Erosion Sedimentation Control Required? N

Paleo Survey Run? N Paleo Potental Observed? N Cultural Survey Run? Y Cultural Resources?

Reserve Pit

Site-Specific Factors Site Ranking

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
Distance to Surface Water (feet)
Dist. Nearest Municipal Well (ft)

Distance to Other Wells (feet)
Native Soil Type

Fluid Type
Drill Cuttings

Annual Precipitation (inches)
Affected Populations

Presence Nearby Utility Conduits
Final Score Sensitivity Level

Characteristics / Requirements
Berry plans to drill the well using a closed loop mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for
berming the tanks or will be spread on the location.

Closed Loop Mud Required? Y Liner Required? Liner Thickness Pit Underlayment Required?

Other Observations / Comments
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Characteristics / Requirements
Berry plans to drill the well using a closed loop mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for
berming the tanks or will be spread on the location.

Closed Loop Mud Required? Y Liner Required? Liner Thickness Pit Underlayment Required?

Other Observations / Comments
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Affected Floodplains and/or Wetlands N
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Characteristics / Requirements
Berry plans to drill the well using a closed loop mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for
berming the tanks or will be spread on the location.

Closed Loop Mud Required? Y Liner Required? Liner Thickness Pit Underlayment Required?

Other Observations / Comments
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Evaluator Date / Time
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APD No API WellNo Status Well Type Surf Owner CBM

2333 43013502450000 SITLA OW S No

Operator BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY Surface Owner-APD

Well Name State Tribal 16-10-54 Unit

Field BRUNDAGE CANYON Type of Work DRILL

Location SESE    10    5S    4W    U    474 FSL    658 FEL    GPS Coord (UTM)    558505E    4433902N

Geologic Statement of Basis

The mineral rights for the proposed well are owned by the Ute Tribe. The BLM will be the agency responsible

for evaluating and approving the proposed drilling, casing and cementing programs.

Brad Hill

APD Evaluator

2/9/2010

Date / Time

Surface Statement of Basis

The well site is proposed approximately 18.8 miles +/- south of Myton, Utah along Sowers Canyon Road to the

Brundage Canyon road, then south 0.6 miles then east and north 0.35 miles to the pad of the State Tribal

1&2-15-54 producing oil wells. From this location 0.3 miles of new road will be constructed in a northeasterly

direction to the site. 

The general topography is canyon bottoms with steep sidewalls and side drainages. 

Brundage Canyon is to the west and Sowers Canyon to the north. Both have broad bottoms with numerous

small side drainages forming alluvial fans as they reach the canyon bottoms. Brundage Canyon runs in a

northeasterly direction to its confluence with Sowers Canyon. Sowers Canyon contains a perennial stream,

which flows easterly into Antelope Creek. Antelope Creek flows in a northerly direction to the Duchesne River. 

The proposed State Tribal 16-10-54 oil well is on a bench on the north slope of a hillside or end of a ridge. This

ridge extends to the south and becomes Brundage Ridge. To the north it breaks off into a steep canyon that

continues to the wide bottom of Sowers Canyon. The steam in Sowers Canyon is about ½ mile to the north. The

pad is oriented in an east to west direction along the bench. Three small swales intersect the proposed pad

running in a northerly direction and will be filled. Two of these begin with the location. A diversion is planned

around the south side of the disturbed area, diverting the minimal overland flows both to the east and west. Both

Location corners 2 and 8 will be rounded to avoid excessive fill in these steeper areas. Berry plans to drill the

well using a closed loop mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for berming the tanks or will be

spread on the location. The site appears to be an acceptable location for construction of a pad, drilling and

operating the well. It is the only suitable site in the immediate area. 

The Utah Division of Wildlife Resources owns the surface for this location and the minerals are owned by the

US Government and held in trust for the Ute Indian Tribe. Charles MacDonald of the BLM who represents the

Ute Indian Tribe attended the pre-site evaluation. As he requested on previous locations that day the topsoil for

the site is to be windrowed. The windrow should not exceed 3-feet in height and seeded to establish interim

re-vegetation. He also specified a color that the tanks be painted. 

Ben Williams and Alex Hansen represented the UDWR. The area is critical winter range for elk and deer. A

surface use agreement exists. As part of this agreement Berry has agreed to compensate the UDWR if

construction and drilling activities occur during the period of Nov 1-April 15 which is the critical period for

these species. No other wildlife is expected to be affected. UDWR is to be contacted regarding reclamation

standards for any part of the site including roads and pipelines.

 

Application for Permit to Drill

Statement of Basis
2/11/2010 Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Page 1

’APIWellNo:43013502450000’'APIWellNo:43013502450000'
I

Application for Permit to Drill
Statement of Basis

2/11/2010 Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining rage i

I

APD No API WellNo Status Well Type Surf Owner CBM
2333 43013502450000 SITLA OW S No
Operator BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY Surface Owner-APD

Well Name State Tribal 16-10-54 Unit
Field BRUNDAGE CANYON Type of Work DRILL
Location SESE 10 5S 4W U 474 FSL 658 FEL GPS Coord (UTM) 558505E 4433902N
Geologic Statement of Rasis

The mineral rights for the proposed well are owned by the Ute Tribe. The BLM will be the agency responsible
for evaluating and approving the proposed drilling, casing and cementing programs.

Brad Hill 2/9/2010
APD Evaluator Date / Time

Surface Statement of Basis
The well site is proposed approximately 18.8 miles +/- south of Myton, Utah along Sowers Canyon Road to the
Brundage Canyon road, then south 0.6 miles then east and north 0.35 miles to the pad of the State Tribal
l&2-15-54 producing oil wells. From this location 0.3 miles of new road will be constructed in a northeasterly
direction to the site.
The general topography is canyon bottoms with steep sidewalls and side drainages.
Brundage Canyon is to the west and Sowers Canyon to the north. Both have broad bottoms with numerous
small side drainages forming alluvial fans as they reach the canyon bottoms. Brundage Canyon runs in a
northeasterly direction to its confluence with Sowers Canyon. Sowers Canyon contains a perennial stream,
which flows easterly into Antelope Creek. Antelope Creek flows in a northerly direction to the Duchesne River.

The proposed State Tribal 16-10-54 oil well is on a bench on the north slope of a hillside or end of a ridge. This
ridge extends to the south and becomes Brundage Ridge. To the north it breaks off into a steep canyon that
continues to the wide bottom of Sowers Canyon. The steam in Sowers Canyon is about ½ mile to the north. The
pad is oriented in an east to west direction along the bench. Three small swales intersect the proposed pad
running in a northerly direction and will be filled. Two of these begin with the location. A diversion is planned
around the south side of the disturbed area, diverting the minimal overland flows both to the east and west. Both
Location corners 2 and 8 will be rounded to avoid excessive fill in these steeper areas. Berry plans to drill the
well using a closed loop mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for berming the tanks or will be
spread on the location. The site appears to be an acceptable location for construction of a pad, drilling and
operating the well. It is the only suitable site in the immediate area.

The Utah Division of Wildlife Resources owns the surface for this location and the minerals are owned by the
US Government and held in trust for the Ute Indian Tribe. Charles MacDonald of the BLM who represents the
Ute Indian Tribe attended the pre-site evaluation. As he requested on previous locations that day the topsoil for
the site is to be windrowed. The windrow should not exceed 3-feet in height and seeded to establish interim
re-vegetation. He also specified a color that the tanks be painted.

Ben Williams and Alex Hansen represented the UDWR. The area is critical winter range for elk and deer. A
surface use agreement exists. As part of this agreement Berry has agreed to compensate the UDWR if
construction and drilling activities occur during the period of Nov 1-April 15 which is the critical period for
these species. No other wildlife is expected to be affected. UDWR is to be contacted regarding reclamation
standards for any part of the site including roads and
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APD No API WellNo Status Well Type Surf Owner CBM
2333 43013502450000 SITLA OW S No
Operator BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY Surface Owner-APD

Well Name State Tribal 16-10-54 Unit
Field BRUNDAGE CANYON Type of Work DRILL
Location SESE 10 5S 4W U 474 FSL 658 FEL GPS Coord (UTM) 558505E 4433902N
Geolooic Statement of Basis

The mineral rights for the proposed well are owned by the Ute Tribe. The BLM will be the agency responsible
for evaluating and approving the proposed drilling, casing and cementing programs.

Brad Hill 2/9/2010
APD Evaluator Date / Time

Surface Statement of Basis
The well site is proposed approximately 18.8 miles +/- south of Myton, Utah along Sowers Canyon Road to the
Brundage Canyon road, then south 0.6 miles then east and north 0.35 miles to the pad of the State Tribal
l&2-15-54 producing oil wells. From this location 0.3 miles of new road will be constructed in a northeasterly
direction to the site.
The general topography is canyon bottoms with steep sidewalls and side drainages.
Brundage Canyon is to the west and Sowers Canyon to the north. Both have broad bottoms with numerous
small side drainages forming alluvial fans as they reach the canyon bottoms. Brundage Canyon runs in a
northeasterly direction to its confluence with Sowers Canyon. Sowers Canyon contains a perennial stream,
which flows easterly into Antelope Creek. Antelope Creek flows in a northerly direction to the Duchesne River.

The proposed State Tribal 16-10-54 oil well is on a bench on the north slope of a hillside or end of a ridge. This
ridge extends to the south and becomes Brundage Ridge. To the north it breaks off into a steep canyon that
continues to the wide bottom of Sowers Canyon. The steam in Sowers Canyon is about ½ mile to the north. The
pad is oriented in an east to west direction along the bench. Three small swales intersect the proposed pad
running in a northerly direction and will be filled. Two of these begin with the location. A diversion is planned
around the south side of the disturbed area, diverting the minimal overland flows both to the east and west. Both
Location corners 2 and 8 will be rounded to avoid excessive fill in these steeper areas. Berry plans to drill the
well using a closed loop mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for berming the tanks or will be
spread on the location. The site appears to be an acceptable location for construction of a pad, drilling and
operating the well. It is the only suitable site in the immediate area.

The Utah Division of Wildlife Resources owns the surface for this location and the minerals are owned by the
US Government and held in trust for the Ute Indian Tribe. Charles MacDonald of the BLM who represents the
Ute Indian Tribe attended the pre-site evaluation. As he requested on previous locations that day the topsoil for
the site is to be windrowed. The windrow should not exceed 3-feet in height and seeded to establish interim
re-vegetation. He also specified a color that the tanks be painted.

Ben Williams and Alex Hansen represented the UDWR. The area is critical winter range for elk and deer. A
surface use agreement exists. As part of this agreement Berry has agreed to compensate the UDWR if
construction and drilling activities occur during the period of Nov 1-April 15 which is the critical period for
these species. No other wildlife is expected to be affected. UDWR is to be contacted regarding reclamation
standards for any part of the site including roads and
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APD No API WellNo Status Well Type Surf Owner CBM
2333 43013502450000 SITLA OW S No
Operator BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY Surface Owner-APD

Well Name State Tribal 16-10-54 Unit
Field BRUNDAGE CANYON Type of Work DRILL
Location SESE 10 5S 4W U 474 FSL 658 FEL GPS Coord (UTM) 558505E 4433902N
Geolooic Statement of Basis

The mineral rights for the proposed well are owned by the Ute Tribe. The BLM will be the agency responsible
for evaluating and approving the proposed drilling, casing and cementing programs.

Brad Hill 2/9/2010
APD Evaluator Date / Time

Surface Statement of Basis
The well site is proposed approximately 18.8 miles +/- south of Myton, Utah along Sowers Canyon Road to the
Brundage Canyon road, then south 0.6 miles then east and north 0.35 miles to the pad of the State Tribal
l&2-15-54 producing oil wells. From this location 0.3 miles of new road will be constructed in a northeasterly
direction to the site.
The general topography is canyon bottoms with steep sidewalls and side drainages.
Brundage Canyon is to the west and Sowers Canyon to the north. Both have broad bottoms with numerous
small side drainages forming alluvial fans as they reach the canyon bottoms. Brundage Canyon runs in a
northeasterly direction to its confluence with Sowers Canyon. Sowers Canyon contains a perennial stream,
which flows easterly into Antelope Creek. Antelope Creek flows in a northerly direction to the Duchesne River.

The proposed State Tribal 16-10-54 oil well is on a bench on the north slope of a hillside or end of a ridge. This
ridge extends to the south and becomes Brundage Ridge. To the north it breaks off into a steep canyon that
continues to the wide bottom of Sowers Canyon. The steam in Sowers Canyon is about ½ mile to the north. The
pad is oriented in an east to west direction along the bench. Three small swales intersect the proposed pad
running in a northerly direction and will be filled. Two of these begin with the location. A diversion is planned
around the south side of the disturbed area, diverting the minimal overland flows both to the east and west. Both
Location corners 2 and 8 will be rounded to avoid excessive fill in these steeper areas. Berry plans to drill the
well using a closed loop mud circulation system. Drilling cuttings will be used for berming the tanks or will be
spread on the location. The site appears to be an acceptable location for construction of a pad, drilling and
operating the well. It is the only suitable site in the immediate area.

The Utah Division of Wildlife Resources owns the surface for this location and the minerals are owned by the
US Government and held in trust for the Ute Indian Tribe. Charles MacDonald of the BLM who represents the
Ute Indian Tribe attended the pre-site evaluation. As he requested on previous locations that day the topsoil for
the site is to be windrowed. The windrow should not exceed 3-feet in height and seeded to establish interim
re-vegetation. He also specified a color that the tanks be painted.

Ben Williams and Alex Hansen represented the UDWR. The area is critical winter range for elk and deer. A
surface use agreement exists. As part of this agreement Berry has agreed to compensate the UDWR if
construction and drilling activities occur during the period of Nov 1-April 15 which is the critical period for
these species. No other wildlife is expected to be affected. UDWR is to be contacted regarding reclamation
standards for any part of the site including roads and



Floyd Bartlett

Onsite Evaluator

1/19/2010

Date / Time

Conditions of Approval / Application for Permit to Drill

Category Condition

Pits A closed loop mud circulation system is required for this location.

Surface Drainages adjacent to the proposed pad shall be diverted around the location.
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WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 2/2/2010 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43013502450000

WELL NAME: State Tribal 16-10-54   

OPERATOR: BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY (N2480) PHONE NUMBER: 435 722-1325

CONTACT: Kathy K. Fieldsted   

PROPOSED LOCATION: SESE 10 050S 040W Permit Tech Review:

SURFACE: 0474 FSL 0658 FEL Engineering Review:

BOTTOM: 0474 FSL 0658 FEL Geology Review:

COUNTY: DUCHESNE 

LATITUDE: 40.05523 LONGITUDE: -110.31408

UTM SURF EASTINGS: 558505.00 NORTHINGS: 4433902.00

FIELD NAME: BRUNDAGE CANYON   

LEASE TYPE: 2 - Indian   

LEASE NUMBER: 14-20-H62-5517             PROPOSED PRODUCING FORMATION(S): GREEN RIVER-WASATCH 

SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State COALBED METHANE: NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

PLAT R649-2-3.

Bond: INDIAN - RLB0005651      Unit:  

Potash R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5      

Oil Shale 190-3 R649-3-3. Exception

Oil Shale 190-13  Drilling Unit 

Water Permit: 431723           Board Cause No:  R649-3-2

RDCC Review:           Effective Date:  

Fee Surface Agreement           Siting:  

Intent to Commingle R649-3-11. Directional Drill

 Commingling Approved  

Comments:          Presite Completed
                  

Stipulations:         4 - Federal Approval - dmason
                             5 - Statement of Basis - bhill
                             23 - Spacing - dmason
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Permit To Drill

******************
Well Name:  State Tribal 16-10-54

API Well Number:  43013502450000

Lease Number:  14-20-H62-5517

Surface Owner:   STATE 

Approval Date:  2/17/2010

Issued to:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY, 4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735, Roosevelt, UT 84066

Authority:
Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. §40-6-1 et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit to drill the listed
well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of R649-3-2. The expected producing
formation or pool is the GREEN RIVER-WASATCH Formation(s), completion into any other zones
will require filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool
will require approval in accordance with R649-3-22.

Duration:
This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous operation
is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date

General:
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to drill.

Conditions of Approval:
State approval of this well does not supercede the required federal approval, which must be obtained
prior to drilling. 

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have not been
established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”). In order to avoid the
possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is requested, once the well has been
drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze geological and engineering data generated
therefrom, as well as any similar data from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable
after completion of its analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter
section upon which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an
appropriate order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board. 

Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in the
Statement of Basis (copy attached). 

Notification Requirements:
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following actions during

API Well No: 43013502450000API Well No: 43013502450000

State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

-/ MICHAEL R. STYLER

GAR . H BE RT
Exoutim Drotor

comrmr Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieuterant Gowrær Busion Director

Permit To Drill
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Well Name: State Tribal 16-10-54
API Well Number: 43013502450000

Lease Number: 14-20-H62-5517
Surface Owner: STATE
Approval Date: 2/17/2010

Issued to:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY, 4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735, Roosevelt, UT 84066

Authority:
Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. §40-6-1et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit to drill the listed
well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of R649-3-2. The expected producing
formation or pool is the GREEN RIVER-WASATCH Formation(s), completion into any other zones
will require filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool
will require approval in accordance with R649-3-22.

Duration:
This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous operation
is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date

General:
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to drill.

Conditions of Approval:
State approval of this well does not supercede the required federal approval, which must be obtained
prior to drilling.

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have not been
established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board"). In order to avoid the
possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is requested, once the well has been
drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze geological and engineering data generated
therefrom, as well as any similar data from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable
after completion of its analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter
section upon which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an
appropriate order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in the
Statement of Basis (copy attached).

Notification Requirements:
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following actions
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drilling of this well:
   • Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well – contact Carol Daniels at 801-538-5284
     (please leave a voicemail message if not available)
     OR
     submit an electronic sundry notice (pre-registration required) via the Utah Oil & Gas website
     at https://oilgas.ogm.utah.gov

Reporting Requirements:
All reports, forms and submittals as required by the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
will be promptly filed with the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, including but not limited to:
   • Entity Action Form (Form 6) – due within 5 days of spudding the well
   • Monthly Status Report (Form 9) – due by 5th day of the following calendar month
   • Requests to Change Plans (Form 9) – due prior to implementation
   • Written Notice of Emergency Changes (Form 9) – due within 5 days
   • Notice of Operations Suspension or Resumption (Form 9) – due prior to implementation
   • Report of Water Encountered (Form 7) – due within 30 days after completion
   • Well Completion Report (Form 8) – due within 30 days after completion or plugging

Approved By:

Gil Hunt
Associate Director, Oil & Gas 
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• Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well - contact Carol Daniels at 801-538-5284
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API Well No: 43013502450000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-5517 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 Ute 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 State Tribal 16-10-54 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BRUNDAGE CANYON 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0474 FSL 0658 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

3/20/2010

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL WAS SPUD ON 03/20/2010 @
APPROX 8:00 AM BY CRAIG'S 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Kathy K. Fieldsted

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3/22/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 999-4044  Ext 

SPUD

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 722-1325

March 23, 2010

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

/ SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:

3/20/20 10 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SPUD

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL WAS SPUD ON 03/20/2010 @
APPROX 8:00 AM BY CRAIG'S Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâggQgLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

/ SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:

3/20/20 10 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SPUD

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL WAS SPUD ON 03/20/2010 @
APPROX 8:00 AM BY CRAIG'S Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâggQgLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

/ SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:

3/20/20 10 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SPUD

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL WAS SPUD ON 03/20/2010 @
APPROX 8:00 AM BY CRAIG'S Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâggQgLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



API Well No: 43013502450000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-5517 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 Ute 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 State Tribal 16-10-54 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BRUNDAGE CANYON 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0474 FSL 0658 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

3/20/2010

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL WAS SPUD ON 03/20/2010 @
APPROX 8:00 AM BY CRAIG'S 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Kathy K. Fieldsted

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3/22/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 999-4044  Ext 

SPUD

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 722-1325

March 23, 2010

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

/ SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:

3/20/20 10 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SPUD

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL WAS SPUD ON 03/20/2010 @
APPROX 8:00 AM BY CRAIG'S Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâggQgLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

/ SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:

3/20/20 10 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SPUD

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL WAS SPUD ON 03/20/2010 @
APPROX 8:00 AM BY CRAIG'S Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâggQgLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

/ SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:

3/20/20 10 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: SPUD

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL WAS SPUD ON 03/20/2010 @
APPROX 8:00 AM BY CRAIG'S Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâggQgLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



API Well No: 43013502450000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-5517 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 Ute 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 State Tribal 16-10-54 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BRUNDAGE CANYON 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0474 FSL 0658 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

4/22/2010

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please see the attached Drilling History for the State Tribal 16-10-54. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Kathy K. Fieldsted

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4/26/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 999-4044  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 722-1325

April 26, 2010

April 26, 2010

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Bo× 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

4/22/2010
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see the attached Drilling History for the State Tribal 16-10-54.
Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECgg2 LY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/26/2010

RECEIVED April 26,

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Bo× 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

4/22/2010
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see the attached Drilling History for the State Tribal 16-10-54.
Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECgg2 LY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/26/2010

RECEIVED April 26,

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Bo× 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

4/22/2010
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see the attached Drilling History for the State Tribal 16-10-54.
Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECgg2 LY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/26/2010

RECEIVED April 26,



April 26, 2010

- Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/15/2010
Report #: 1, DFS:

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress:
APl/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Nottee APD State AFE NumÏer Total AFE Amount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Pig ReÍease Öslo KŠ·Ground Dislance (fi) Grourd ËÏevation(ItKB) Daily CosÏ

¯ ¯
Cum C st To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 39,197 39,197
Operations at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Addilive Cosl To Date
Mob. f/ ST 5-15D-54 to ST 16-10-54 Mob. to ST 16-10-54 & spud
Operations Summary Deplh Stad (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)

Prepare to mob. 0 0
Remarks Depth Slart (TVD) (ftKB) Depth End (TVD) (ftKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Hole CondÏÏion ÌargetFormation Target Depth (ftKB)
Clear 36.0 Dusty Cased Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set __ _ Daily Contacts
Castng Descnption Set Depth (ftKB) OD (in) Comment Job Conlact Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz 281-605-2103

Rlgs|Time Lo9 Contractor Rig Number
| Start Time End Time | Dur (hrs) Operation Comment Frontier 5
00:00 06:00 | 6.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Rig down & prepare to mob.I MudPumpo
Mud Checks #2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Type |Time Depth (flKB) Densily (ibigal) Vis (s/qi) PV Calc (cp) Yield Poini (Ibfl100fP) Pump Raling (hp) Rod Diameier (in) |Stroke Longih fin)

800.0 | 7.99
Gol (108) [lbf/100 Gol (10m} IbliiO . Gol (30m) Ibfl10.. Fillrale (mU30msn) Filter Cake (132") pH Solids (Ÿ) LÏnerSize (in) VoltStk OR (bbl/stk

MBT (Ibibbl} Percent OII(%) PercenI Water (% Chloridas(trxfL) Calctum(mg/L) K0L (%) ËIectÑcStab (g Pressure (psi) o dO Sirokes (spm) Ett (%)

CEC Íor Collings Whole MudAdd (bbi) MudLosito Hole (bt I) Mud Lost (SurÏ)]bbi)Mt d Vol (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Act) (bbi) # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameier (in) Stroke Length fin)

Air Data 800.0 7.99
Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/stk)

Parasite ACFM (ft=/min Drillpipe ACFM (fÏalmin)ECD Bil (Ib/gal) ECD Parasite (Ib/gal) 6 1/2 3.280
Pressure (psi) low Spd Slrokes (spm) Eff (%)

No
i Corrosion Inhibitor In ected in 24hr Period --- --- -- -

gis Injected down Parasile (gal gis Injected in Mud (gal) gls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal) lillUd AddliiWW ÂIIIUUIIÊ,:I

Description Consumed Daily Cost

Drill Strings IJob Supplies

Bli Run Drill8il lADCBit Dull TFA (inci Noz) (in') Supply item De ription Unit Label

Nozzles (/37) Stang Length (ft) Slring WI (1000\bf) BHA ROP (ft Tolal Received Total Consumed Total Returned

Drill String Components Diesel Fuel Consumption
max Date | Consumed

Lobe Bit-Bend ft. min gpm gpm
Jts llem Description OD (in) Len (ft) confi9 Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN

Drilling Parameters
Wollbore Start (flKB) Depih End (ItKB} CumDepih (fi) DrillTime (hrs) Cum DriliTime Inl ROP (filhr) Flow Rate (Opm

WOB (10001bf) RPM rpm) SPP (psij floi HL 1000167) PU HL (1000ibn SO HL (10DDÍbf)Orililng Ìcrque Off BimT i

O (g ini) (fi'l Motor RPM (rpm) T (16) (*F) P (OH Ann) ( T (bh) ('F) P(SurfAnn) T (surf ann) Q (lig rtrn) (g Q (greturni

Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim Dale Descnption EWTie In.. Inclin MD Tie In (fl... NSTie In TVDTie In (ft
0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Survey Data
MD (ftKB) Í incl (') | Azm (°) TVD (ftKB) NS (ft) | EW (ft) | VS (ft) I DLS (°/100ft)

I

i

' ¯ ¯ ¯
RECEIVED Apn126,

- Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/15/2010
Report #: 1, DFS:

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress:
APl/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Nottee APD State AFE NumÏer Total AFE Amount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Pig ReÍease Öslo KŠ·Ground Dislance (fi) Grourd ËÏevation(ItKB) Daily CosÏ

¯ ¯
Cum C st To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 39,197 39,197
Operations at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Addilive Cosl To Date
Mob. f/ ST 5-15D-54 to ST 16-10-54 Mob. to ST 16-10-54 & spud
Operations Summary Deplh Stad (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)

Prepare to mob. 0 0
Remarks Depth Slart (TVD) (ftKB) Depth End (TVD) (ftKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Hole CondÏÏion ÌargetFormation Target Depth (ftKB)
Clear 36.0 Dusty Cased Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set __ _ Daily Contacts
Castng Descnption Set Depth (ftKB) OD (in) Comment Job Conlact Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz 281-605-2103

Rlgs|Time Lo9 Contractor Rig Number
| Start Time End Time | Dur (hrs) Operation Comment Frontier 5
00:00 06:00 | 6.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Rig down & prepare to mob.I MudPumpo
Mud Checks #2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Type |Time Depth (flKB) Densily (ibigal) Vis (s/qi) PV Calc (cp) Yield Poini (Ibfl100fP) Pump Raling (hp) Rod Diameier (in) |Stroke Longih fin)

800.0 | 7.99
Gol (108) [lbf/100 Gol (10m} IbliiO . Gol (30m) Ibfl10.. Fillrale (mU30msn) Filter Cake (132") pH Solids (Ÿ) LÏnerSize (in) VoltStk OR (bbl/stk

MBT (Ibibbl} Percent OII(%) PercenI Water (% Chloridas(trxfL) Calctum(mg/L) K0L (%) ËIectÑcStab (g Pressure (psi) o dO Sirokes (spm) Ett (%)

CEC Íor Collings Whole MudAdd (bbi) MudLosito Hole (bt I) Mud Lost (SurÏ)]bbi)Mt d Vol (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Act) (bbi) # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameier (in) Stroke Length fin)

Air Data 800.0 7.99
Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/stk)

Parasite ACFM (ft=/min Drillpipe ACFM (fÏalmin)ECD Bil (Ib/gal) ECD Parasite (Ib/gal) 6 1/2 3.280
Pressure (psi) low Spd Slrokes (spm) Eff (%)

No
i Corrosion Inhibitor In ected in 24hr Period --- --- -- -

gis Injected down Parasile (gal gis Injected in Mud (gal) gls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal) lillUd AddliiWW ÂIIIUUIIÊ,:I

Description Consumed Daily Cost

Drill Strings IJob Supplies

Bli Run Drill8il lADCBit Dull TFA (inci Noz) (in') Supply item De ription Unit Label

Nozzles (/37) Stang Length (ft) Slring WI (1000\bf) BHA ROP (ft Tolal Received Total Consumed Total Returned

Drill String Components Diesel Fuel Consumption
max Date | Consumed

Lobe Bit-Bend ft. min gpm gpm
Jts llem Description OD (in) Len (ft) confi9 Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN

Drilling Parameters
Wollbore Start (flKB) Depih End (ItKB} CumDepih (fi) DrillTime (hrs) Cum DriliTime Inl ROP (filhr) Flow Rate (Opm

WOB (10001bf) RPM rpm) SPP (psij floi HL 1000167) PU HL (1000ibn SO HL (10DDÍbf)Orililng Ìcrque Off BimT i

O (g ini) (fi'l Motor RPM (rpm) T (16) (*F) P (OH Ann) ( T (bh) ('F) P(SurfAnn) T (surf ann) Q (lig rtrn) (g Q (greturni

Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim Dale Descnption EWTie In.. Inclin MD Tie In (fl... NSTie In TVDTie In (ft
0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Survey Data
MD (ftKB) Í incl (') | Azm (°) TVD (ftKB) NS (ft) | EW (ft) | VS (ft) I DLS (°/100ft)

I

i

' ¯ ¯ ¯
RECEIVED Apn126,

- Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/15/2010
Report #: 1, DFS:

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress:
APl/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Nottee APD State AFE NumÏer Total AFE Amount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Pig ReÍease Öslo KŠ·Ground Dislance (fi) Grourd ËÏevation(ItKB) Daily CosÏ

¯ ¯
Cum C st To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 39,197 39,197
Operations at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Addilive Cosl To Date
Mob. f/ ST 5-15D-54 to ST 16-10-54 Mob. to ST 16-10-54 & spud
Operations Summary Deplh Stad (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)

Prepare to mob. 0 0
Remarks Depth Slart (TVD) (ftKB) Depth End (TVD) (ftKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Hole CondÏÏion ÌargetFormation Target Depth (ftKB)
Clear 36.0 Dusty Cased Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set __ _ Daily Contacts
Castng Descnption Set Depth (ftKB) OD (in) Comment Job Conlact Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz 281-605-2103

Rlgs|Time Lo9 Contractor Rig Number
| Start Time End Time | Dur (hrs) Operation Comment Frontier 5
00:00 06:00 | 6.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Rig down & prepare to mob.

I MudPumpo
Mud Checks #2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Type |Time Depth (flKB) Densily (ibigal) Vis (s/qi) PV Calc (cp) Yield Poini (Ibfl100fP) Pump Raling (hp) Rod Diameier (in) |Stroke Longih fin)

800.0 | 7.99
Gol (108) [lbf/100 Gol (10m} IbliiO . Gol (30m) Ibfl10.. Fillrale (mU30msn) Filter Cake (132") pH Solids (Ÿ) LÏnerSize (in) VoltStk OR (bbl/stk

MBT (Ibibbl} Percent OII(%) PercenI Water (% Chloridas(trxfL) Calctum(mg/L) K0L (%) ËIectÑcStab (g Pressure (psi) o dO Sirokes (spm) Ett (%)

CEC Íor Collings Whole MudAdd (bbi) MudLosito Hole (bt I) Mud Lost (SurÏ)]bbi)Mt d Vol (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Act) (bbi) # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameier (in) Stroke Length fin)

Air Data 800.0 7.99
Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/stk)

Parasite ACFM (ft=/min Drillpipe ACFM (fÏalmin)ECD Bil (Ib/gal) ECD Parasite (Ib/gal) 6 1/2 3.280
Pressure (psi) low Spd Slrokes (spm) Eff (%)

No
i Corrosion Inhibitor In ected in 24hr Period --- --- -- -

gis Injected down Parasile (gal gis Injected in Mud (gal) gls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal) lillUd AddliiWW ÂIIIUUIIÊ,:I

Description Consumed Daily Cost

Drill Strings IJob Supplies

Bli Run Drill8il lADCBit Dull TFA (inci Noz) (in') Supply item De ription Unit Label

Nozzles (/37) Stang Length (ft) Slring WI (1000\bf) BHA ROP (ft Tolal Received Total Consumed Total Returned

Drill String Components Diesel Fuel Consumption
max Date | Consumed

Lobe Bit-Bend ft. min gpm gpm
Jts llem Description OD (in) Len (ft) confi9 Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN

Drilling Parameters
Wollbore Start (flKB) Depih End (ItKB} CumDepih (fi) DrillTime (hrs) Cum DriliTime Inl ROP (filhr) Flow Rate (Opm

WOB (10001bf) RPM rpm) SPP (psij floi HL 1000167) PU HL (1000ibn SO HL (10DDÍbf)Orililng Ìcrque Off BimT i

O (g ini) (fi'l Motor RPM (rpm) T (16) (*F) P (OH Ann) ( T (bh) ('F) P(SurfAnn) T (surf ann) Q (lig rtrn) (g Q (greturni

Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim Dale Descnption EWTie In.. Inclin MD Tie In (fl... NSTie In TVDTie In (ft
0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Survey Data
MD (ftKB) Í incl (') | Azm (°) TVD (ftKB) NS (ft) | EW (ft) | VS (ft) I DLS (°/100ft)

I

i

' ¯ ¯ ¯
RECEIVED Apn126,



April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/16/2010
Report #: 2, DFS:

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 0
API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD 3tate AFE Number Tolal AFE Amouni
43-013-50245 ISESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Rig Release Dale lŒ-GroundDislance (fl) Ground EÍevation(ftKB) Daily Cost Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 26,884 66,081
Operations al Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
M/U BHA #1 Drill 7 7/8" hole.
Operations Summary Depth Start (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)
Mob. fl ST S-15D-54 to St 16-10-54,Rig up, Modify pump suction lines. 365 365
Remarks Depth Start (WD) (ftKB) Depth End (WD) (ftKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews. The steering arm on the unit broke enroute to new location. 365 365
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condúson Hole C dÍÍion Target Formation Targel Depth (ftKB)
Clear 40.0 Dusty Cased Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set _ Daily Contacts
Casing Descnption Set Depth (flKB) OD (in) Comment Job Contacl Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz 281-605-2103

Rigs
, Time Loß Contractor Rig Number
Slart Time | End Time Dur (hrS) Operation Comment Frontier 506:00 07:00 1.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Wait on daylight to commence mobilization

of equipment. Mud Pumps
# 2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

07:00 .09:00 2.00 Rig Up &Tear Down Set out front & back yard. Prep unit (Of Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter(in) Stroke Lenglh (in)
mob., load sub structure 800.0 i 7.99

09:00 11:00 2.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Road unit to ST 16-10-54, Set matting Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/slk)
boards & sub. 6 1/2 3.280

11:00 13:00 2.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Manuver unit onto mud boat with out Pr*66"re lP6i) ÍSlow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
steering arm. | No i

13:00 16:00 3.00 Rig Up &Tear Down Set in pumps, water tank, mud pits, Brandt #1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
eqeu ment, raise derrick & hook up guy Pump Rati (hp) Rod Diameter (in troke Len9gth(in)

Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/stk)
|16:00 18:00 2.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Rig up floor, P/U kelly 6 1/2 3.280
I18:00 20:00 2.00 NU/ND BOP Nipple up BOP Pressure(psi) SlowSpd Strokes(spm) Eff(%)
20:00 00:30 4.50 Test BOP Test Pipe / Blind Rams / Choke Manifold / No

Upper & Lower kelly valves to 2000 psi High Mud Additive Amounts
/ 250 psi. Low. Tested annular 1500 psi. Description Consumed Daily Cosl
High / 250 Low f/ 15 min. Tested casing @
1500 psi. fl 30 min Job Supplies

00:30 03:00 2.50 Trips Strap BHA,P/U kelly & run pumps test circ.
system. Pre spud inspection,fill pits. Supply itemDescripiion Unit Label

03:00 06:00 3.00 Trips M/UBHA wÏMud motor & EMAG tool Total Received Total Consumed Total Returned

Mud Checks
Type |Timo Depth (ftKB) |Densily (Ib/gal) Vis (sigt) PV Calc (cp) Yield Point (ibfl10Dri') Diesel Fuel Consumption

Date I Consumed
i .. I I

¯
Col (10s) (Ibf/100 Gel (10m) (Ibf/10 . Ge! (30m) (Ibf/10 .. Fillrale (mL/30min) Filter Cake (132") IpH Solids (°/o)

MBT (Ib/btii) Percent Oil (%) Percent Water (%) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electnc Stab (V)

CEC for Cuttings Whole Mud Add (bbl) Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Lost (Surf) (bbi) Mud Vol (Res) (bbl) ud Vol (Acl) (bbl)

iAir Data

iParasite ACFM (ft3/min) Drilipipe ACFM (ft3/min) ECD Bil (Ib/gal) ECD Parasite (Ib/gal)

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period
Igls Injected down Parasile (gal) |glsInjected in Mud (gal) gls Blocide injectedin Mud (gal)

Drill Strings
BHA #1, Vertical Assy.
Bil Nun Dn!! Bit IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (in2)

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-O-NO-TD 1.18
Nozzles (/32") Sinng Longib (fi) String Wt (1000lbf) BHA ROP (f1

16/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9
Drill String Components

max
Lobe Bit-Bend fL min gpm gpm

Jts Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN
1 Mud Motor 6 1/2 29.18

i 1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9 8
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.26

30.HWDP 4 1/2 921.85

RECEIVED April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/16/2010
Report #: 2, DFS:

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 0
API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD 3tate AFE Number Tolal AFE Amouni
43-013-50245 ISESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Rig Release Dale lŒ-GroundDislance (fl) Ground EÍevation(ftKB) Daily Cost Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 26,884 66,081
Operations al Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
M/U BHA #1 Drill 7 7/8" hole.
Operations Summary Depth Start (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)
Mob. fl ST S-15D-54 to St 16-10-54,Rig up, Modify pump suction lines. 365 365
Remarks Depth Start (WD) (ftKB) Depth End (WD) (ftKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews. The steering arm on the unit broke enroute to new location. 365 365
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condúson Hole C dÍÍion Target Formation Targel Depth (ftKB)
Clear 40.0 Dusty Cased Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set _ Daily Contacts
Casing Descnption Set Depth (flKB) OD (in) Comment Job Contacl Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz 281-605-2103

Rigs
, Time Loß Contractor Rig Number
Slart Time | End Time Dur (hrS) Operation Comment Frontier 506:00 07:00 1.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Wait on daylight to commence mobilization

of equipment. Mud Pumps
# 2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

07:00 .09:00 2.00 Rig Up &Tear Down Set out front & back yard. Prep unit (Of Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter(in) Stroke Lenglh (in)
mob., load sub structure 800.0 i 7.99

09:00 11:00 2.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Road unit to ST 16-10-54, Set matting Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/slk)
boards & sub. 6 1/2 3.280

11:00 13:00 2.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Manuver unit onto mud boat with out Pr*66"re lP6i) ÍSlow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
steering arm. | No i

13:00 16:00 3.00 Rig Up &Tear Down Set in pumps, water tank, mud pits, Brandt #1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
eqeu ment, raise derrick & hook up guy Pump Rati (hp) Rod Diameter (in troke Len9gth(in)

Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/stk)
|16:00 18:00 2.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Rig up floor, P/U kelly 6 1/2 3.280
I18:00 20:00 2.00 NU/ND BOP Nipple up BOP Pressure(psi) SlowSpd Strokes(spm) Eff(%)
20:00 00:30 4.50 Test BOP Test Pipe / Blind Rams / Choke Manifold / No

Upper & Lower kelly valves to 2000 psi High Mud Additive Amounts
/ 250 psi. Low. Tested annular 1500 psi. Description Consumed Daily Cosl
High / 250 Low f/ 15 min. Tested casing @
1500 psi. fl 30 min Job Supplies

00:30 03:00 2.50 Trips Strap BHA,P/U kelly & run pumps test circ.
system. Pre spud inspection,fill pits. Supply itemDescripiion Unit Label

03:00 06:00 3.00 Trips M/UBHA wÏMud motor & EMAG tool Total Received Total Consumed Total Returned

Mud Checks
Type |Timo Depth (ftKB) |Densily (Ib/gal) Vis (sigt) PV Calc (cp) Yield Point (ibfl10Dri') Diesel Fuel Consumption

Date I Consumed
i .. I I

¯
Col (10s) (Ibf/100 Gel (10m) (Ibf/10 . Ge! (30m) (Ibf/10 .. Fillrale (mL/30min) Filter Cake (132") IpH Solids (°/o)

MBT (Ib/btii) Percent Oil (%) Percent Water (%) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electnc Stab (V)

CEC for Cuttings Whole Mud Add (bbl) Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Lost (Surf) (bbi) Mud Vol (Res) (bbl) ud Vol (Acl) (bbl)

iAir Data

iParasite ACFM (ft3/min) Drilipipe ACFM (ft3/min) ECD Bil (Ib/gal) ECD Parasite (Ib/gal)

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period
Igls Injected down Parasile (gal) |glsInjected in Mud (gal) gls Blocide injectedin Mud (gal)

Drill Strings
BHA #1, Vertical Assy.
Bil Nun Dn!! Bit IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (in2)

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-O-NO-TD 1.18
Nozzles (/32") Sinng Longib (fi) String Wt (1000lbf) BHA ROP (f1

16/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9
Drill String Components

max
Lobe Bit-Bend fL min gpm gpm

Jts Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN
1 Mud Motor 6 1/2 29.18

i 1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9 8
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.26

30.HWDP 4 1/2 921.85

RECEIVED April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/16/2010
Report #: 2, DFS:

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 0
API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD 3tate AFE Number Tolal AFE Amouni
43-013-50245 ISESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Rig Release Dale lŒ-GroundDislance (fl) Ground EÍevation(ftKB) Daily Cost Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 26,884 66,081
Operations al Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
M/U BHA #1 Drill 7 7/8" hole.
Operations Summary Depth Start (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)
Mob. fl ST S-15D-54 to St 16-10-54,Rig up, Modify pump suction lines. 365 365
Remarks Depth Start (WD) (ftKB) Depth End (WD) (ftKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews. The steering arm on the unit broke enroute to new location. 365 365
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condúson Hole C dÍÍion Target Formation Targel Depth (ftKB)
Clear 40.0 Dusty Cased Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set _ Daily Contacts
Casing Descnption Set Depth (flKB) OD (in) Comment Job Contacl Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz 281-605-2103

Rigs
, Time Loß Contractor Rig Number
Slart Time | End Time Dur (hrS) Operation Comment Frontier 5
06:00 07:00 1.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Wait on daylight to commence mobilization

of equipment. Mud Pumps
# 2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

07:00 .09:00 2.00 Rig Up &Tear Down Set out front & back yard. Prep unit (Of Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter(in) Stroke Lenglh (in)
mob., load sub structure 800.0 i 7.99

09:00 11:00 2.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Road unit to ST 16-10-54, Set matting Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/slk)
boards & sub. 6 1/2 3.280

11:00 13:00 2.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Manuver unit onto mud boat with out Pr*66"re lP6i) ÍSlow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
steering arm. | No i

13:00 16:00 3.00 Rig Up &Tear Down Set in pumps, water tank, mud pits, Brandt #1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
eqeu ment, raise derrick & hook up guy Pump Rati (hp) Rod Diameter (in troke Len9gth(in)

Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/stk)
|16:00 18:00 2.00 Rig Up & Tear Down Rig up floor, P/U kelly 6 1/2 3.280
I18:00 20:00 2.00 NU/ND BOP Nipple up BOP Pressure(psi) SlowSpd Strokes(spm) Eff(%)
20:00 00:30 4.50 Test BOP Test Pipe / Blind Rams / Choke Manifold / No

Upper & Lower kelly valves to 2000 psi High Mud Additive Amounts
/ 250 psi. Low. Tested annular 1500 psi. Description Consumed Daily Cosl
High / 250 Low f/ 15 min. Tested casing @
1500 psi. fl 30 min Job Supplies

00:30 03:00 2.50 Trips Strap BHA,P/U kelly & run pumps test circ.
system. Pre spud inspection,fill pits. Supply itemDescripiion Unit Label

03:00 06:00 3.00 Trips M/UBHA wÏMud motor & EMAG tool Total Received Total Consumed Total Returned

Mud Checks
Type |Timo Depth (ftKB) |Densily (Ib/gal) Vis (sigt) PV Calc (cp) Yield Point (ibfl10Dri') Diesel Fuel Consumption

Date I Consumed
i .. I I

¯
Col (10s) (Ibf/100 Gel (10m) (Ibf/10 . Ge! (30m) (Ibf/10 .. Fillrale (mL/30min) Filter Cake (132") IpH Solids (°/o)

MBT (Ib/btii) Percent Oil (%) Percent Water (%) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electnc Stab (V)

CEC for Cuttings Whole Mud Add (bbl) Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Lost (Surf) (bbi) Mud Vol (Res) (bbl) ud Vol (Acl) (bbl)

iAir Data

iParasite ACFM (ft3/min) Drilipipe ACFM (ft3/min) ECD Bil (Ib/gal) ECD Parasite (Ib/gal)

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period
Igls Injected down Parasile (gal) |glsInjected in Mud (gal) gls Blocide injectedin Mud (gal)

Drill Strings
BHA #1, Vertical Assy.
Bil Nun Dn!! Bit IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (in2)

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-O-NO-TD 1.18
Nozzles (/32") Sinng Longib (fi) String Wt (1000lbf) BHA ROP (f1

16/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9
Drill String Components

max
Lobe Bit-Bend fL min gpm gpm

Jts Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN
1 Mud Motor 6 1/2 29.18

i 1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9 8
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.26

30.HWDP 4 1/2 921.85

RECEIVED April 26, 2010



April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/16/2010 .

Report #: 2, DFS:
Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 0

Drill String Components
max

Lobe Bit-Bend fi mingpm gpm
Jis liem Desenption OD (in) Len gg config Stages rpmfgpm (fi) (gpm) (gpm) SN

1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94
157 Drill Pipe 4 4,964.40

Drilling Parameters
:Wolibero 15tart(flKB) Depth End (flKB Cum Depth (fi} ]Drill Time lhrs) CumDrillTime ... Int ROP (filbr) Flow Rale (gpm)
Original 365.0 365.0 400
Hole
WOB (100010() RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Rot HL (1000Ibi) ÈU HL (1000]bf) SO HL (10Ü0Ibf) DrÏÏlingÏorque Öff$1mŸq

15 60 750.0
O (g mi)(it*/ Molor RPM (rpm) T IIrd ('F) P (BMAno} ( T (bh) ("F) P(SuriAnn) T (surf ann) O (lig rtrn) (g O (grelarn)

Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim Dato Descripilan EVREein . inctn NI0 Tie In ÑSTie in ... TVDTie in (it

.
0.00 | 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0 00 0.00 0 00 0.00 0 00

iSurvey Data
MD (flKB) | Ind (') [ Arm (') [ TVD (flKB) NS (It) ] EW (fi) VS (it} [ DfS ('I100fi)

|

I

I I

¯
RECEIVED April 26,

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/16/2010 .

Report #: 2, DFS:
Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 0

Drill String Components
max

Lobe Bit-Bend fi mingpm gpm
Jis liem Desenption OD (in) Len gg config Stages rpmfgpm (fi) (gpm) (gpm) SN

1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94
157 Drill Pipe 4 4,964.40

Drilling Parameters
:Wolibero 15tart(flKB) Depth End (flKB Cum Depth (fi} ]Drill Time lhrs) CumDrillTime ... Int ROP (filbr) Flow Rale (gpm)
Original 365.0 365.0 400
Hole
WOB (100010() RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Rot HL (1000Ibi) ÈU HL (1000]bf) SO HL (10Ü0Ibf) DrÏÏlingÏorque Öff$1mŸq

15 60 750.0
O (g mi)(it*/ Molor RPM (rpm) T IIrd ('F) P (BMAno} ( T (bh) ("F) P(SuriAnn) T (surf ann) O (lig rtrn) (g O (grelarn)

Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim Dato Descripilan EVREein . inctn NI0 Tie In ÑSTie in ... TVDTie in (it

.
0.00 | 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0 00 0.00 0 00 0.00 0 00

iSurvey Data
MD (flKB) | Ind (') [ Arm (') [ TVD (flKB) NS (It) ] EW (fi) VS (it} [ DfS ('I100fi)

|

I

I I

¯
RECEIVED April 26,

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/16/2010 .

Report #: 2, DFS:
Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 0

Drill String Components
max

Lobe Bit-Bend fi mingpm gpm
Jis liem Desenption OD (in) Len gg config Stages rpmfgpm (fi) (gpm) (gpm) SN

1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94
157 Drill Pipe 4 4,964.40

Drilling Parameters
:Wolibero 15tart(flKB) Depth End (flKB Cum Depth (fi} ]Drill Time lhrs) CumDrillTime ... Int ROP (filbr) Flow Rale (gpm)
Original 365.0 365.0 400
Hole
WOB (100010() RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Rot HL (1000Ibi) ÈU HL (1000]bf) SO HL (10Ü0Ibf) DrÏÏlingÏorque Öff$1mŸq

15 60 750.0
O (g mi)(it*/ Molor RPM (rpm) T IIrd ('F) P (BMAno} ( T (bh) ("F) P(SuriAnn) T (surf ann) O (lig rtrn) (g O (grelarn)

Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim Dato Descripilan EVREein . inctn NI0 Tie In ÑSTie in ... TVDTie in (it

.
0.00 | 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0 00 0.00 0 00 0.00 0 00

iSurvey Data
MD (flKB) | Ind (') [ Arm (') [ TVD (flKB) NS (It) ] EW (fi) VS (it} [ DfS ('I100fi)

|

I

I I

¯
RECEIVED April 26,



April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repon Report Date: 407/2010
Report #: 3, DFS: 0.8 i

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,548
API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD Slale AFE Number Total AFE Arnount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 T5S-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spudna Rig Release Dale KB·Ground Dislance (ft) Ground Elevation (ftKB) Daily Cost Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 32.561 98,642
Operations at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
Drilling 7 7/8" hole @ 1913' Drill7 7/8" hole. 919 919
Operations Summary Depth Start (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)
Picked up BHA, Tagged cmt. @292', Clean out cmt., drilled plug,baffle,shoe track & formation fl 365' to 365 1,913
1913' Depth Starl (TVD) (ftKB) Deplh End (TVD) (ftKB)

Remarks 365 1,913
Held PJSM w/ Crews. Targel Formation Target Depth (ftKB)

Wealher emperature (°F) Road Condilion Hole Condition Wasatch 5.946
Clear

,
39.0 Dusty Good Daily Contacts

Last Casing Set Job Contact | Mobile

Casing Description ŠetDepth (flKB) OD (in) Commenl Kini D. Gril¿. 281-605-2103
Surface 365 Pre-set Rigs

Contraclor Rig Number
Time Log Frontier 5

: Slart Time | End Time Dur (hrs) | Operation Comment
06:00 07:30 1.50lTrips P/U BHA tag cement @292, Mud Pumpo

# 2, Gardner-Denverg807:30 08:00 0,50 Miscellaneous Install rotating head rubber _ _ Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameler (m} S Lenglh (m)
08:00 10:00 2.00 DrillOut Cement/Retainers Drillout cement, plug, baffle @ 324' , shoe 800.0 7.99

track & shoe @ 365' Liner Size (in) VoltSik ÒR (bbitstk)

10:00 17:00 7.00 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole w/ 350-450 gpm, 60 rpm, 6 1/2 3 280
12-16k wob. @ 1-200 fph. PFessure (pii) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Elf (%)

17:00 17:30 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig service & adjust brakes. No ! |

17:30 06:00 12.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 941' to 1913'wl 350-450 # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
gpm, 60 rpm, 16-18k wob. @ 1-200 fph. Pump Rati (hp) Rod Diameter(in) Stroke Len9gth(in)

Mud Checks Liner Size (in) VollŠtk OR (bbl/stk)

,Type Time Depth (ftKB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/ql) PV Calc (cp) Yield Point (Ibf/100ft2 6 1/2 3.280
Water Base 05:00 940.0 8.50 29 1.000 Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Elf (%)

IGel (10s) (Ibf/100 . Gel (10m) (Ibf/10... Gel (30m) (ibf/10. . Filtrate (mL/30min) Filter Cake (/32") pl| Solids (%) 1,000.0 | No 70 95
1.000 11.0 0.7 Mud Additive Amounts

MBT (Ib/bbl) Percent Oil (%) PercenI Water {%) Chlorides mg/L) Calcium (rng)L KCL (%) Eleclric Stab (V) Description Consumed I Daily Cosl

99.3 8,000.000 0.100 Engineering 1.0 400.00
CFC for Cullings Whole Mud Add (bbl) Mud Losi lo Hole (bbl) Mud Losl (Surf) (bbi) Mud Vol (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Acl) (bbl) Gypsum 31.0 423.15

I, _ I Tax 1.0 95.94
Air Data Job Supplies

Parasite ACFM (fts/min) Drillpipe ACFM (ft3Ïmin) ECD Bil (Ib/gal) ECD Parasile (Ïb/gaÍ) Suplify ÏÏ rn Description ÜnilLat eÏ
l i i i l

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Total Received Total Consumed Total Returned

gis injected down Parasite (gal) gis Injected in ÑÍud(gal) gls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal)
Diesel Fuel Consumption

Date Consumed
Drill Strings
BHA #1, Vertical Assy.
Bil Run DrillBit lADC Bit Dull TFA (Incl Noz) (In')

1 7 7/Bin, FX55M, 11404114 | 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD 1.18
Nozzles (/32") String Length (ff) tring Wi (10DDIbf) BHA ROP (It

16/16/16/16/16/16 6.143.47 135 59.9
Drill String Components

max
Lobe Bil-Bend fL mingpm gpm

Jts item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN
1 ÑÏudMotor 6 1/2 29.18
1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.26

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 DrillPipe 4 4,964.40

Drilling Parameters
ÑoÍlBoe Slart (ftKB) ÍÔpi6 EM iÏËiÏB ineihil DrillTime (hrs) Cum DrillTime . Inl ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 365.0 | 1,913.0 | 1,548.00 19.50 19.50 79.4 440
Hole |
WOB (1000lbt) RPM (rpml SPP (psi) Rot HL (100Ölbf)PU HL (1000\bf) SO HL (1000\bf) Drilling Torqúe Off 8tm Tq

O (g ir I (31 Motor RP rpm) T (in;

FOO
P

(BTAnn6)
. T (b )(°F)

6
(surfAnn).

T4(surf
ann)

5 r0n)
(g ..

04

RECEIVED April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repon Report Date: 407/2010
Report #: 3, DFS: 0.8 i

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,548
API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD Slale AFE Number Total AFE Arnount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 T5S-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spudna Rig Release Dale KB·Ground Dislance (ft) Ground Elevation (ftKB) Daily Cost Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 32.561 98,642
Operations at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
Drilling 7 7/8" hole @ 1913' Drill7 7/8" hole. 919 919
Operations Summary Depth Start (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)
Picked up BHA, Tagged cmt. @292', Clean out cmt., drilled plug,baffle,shoe track & formation fl 365' to 365 1,913
1913' Depth Starl (TVD) (ftKB) Deplh End (TVD) (ftKB)

Remarks 365 1,913
Held PJSM w/ Crews. Targel Formation Target Depth (ftKB)

Wealher emperature (°F) Road Condilion Hole Condition Wasatch 5.946
Clear

,
39.0 Dusty Good Daily Contacts

Last Casing Set Job Contact | Mobile

Casing Description ŠetDepth (flKB) OD (in) Commenl Kini D. Gril¿. 281-605-2103
Surface 365 Pre-set Rigs

Contraclor Rig Number
Time Log Frontier 5

: Slart Time | End Time Dur (hrs) | Operation Comment
06:00 07:30 1.50lTrips P/U BHA tag cement @292, Mud Pumpo

# 2, Gardner-Denverg807:30 08:00 0,50 Miscellaneous Install rotating head rubber _ _ Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameler (m} S Lenglh (m)
08:00 10:00 2.00 DrillOut Cement/Retainers Drillout cement, plug, baffle @ 324' , shoe 800.0 7.99

track & shoe @ 365' Liner Size (in) VoltSik ÒR (bbitstk)

10:00 17:00 7.00 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole w/ 350-450 gpm, 60 rpm, 6 1/2 3 280
12-16k wob. @ 1-200 fph. PFessure (pii) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Elf (%)

17:00 17:30 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig service & adjust brakes. No ! |

17:30 06:00 12.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 941' to 1913'wl 350-450 # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
gpm, 60 rpm, 16-18k wob. @ 1-200 fph. Pump Rati (hp) Rod Diameter(in) Stroke Len9gth(in)

Mud Checks Liner Size (in) VollŠtk OR (bbl/stk)

,Type Time Depth (ftKB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/ql) PV Calc (cp) Yield Point (Ibf/100ft2 6 1/2 3.280
Water Base 05:00 940.0 8.50 29 1.000 Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Elf (%)

IGel (10s) (Ibf/100 . Gel (10m) (Ibf/10... Gel (30m) (ibf/10. . Filtrate (mL/30min) Filter Cake (/32") pl| Solids (%) 1,000.0 | No 70 95
1.000 11.0 0.7 Mud Additive Amounts

MBT (Ib/bbl) Percent Oil (%) PercenI Water {%) Chlorides mg/L) Calcium (rng)L KCL (%) Eleclric Stab (V) Description Consumed I Daily Cosl

99.3 8,000.000 0.100 Engineering 1.0 400.00
CFC for Cullings Whole Mud Add (bbl) Mud Losi lo Hole (bbl) Mud Losl (Surf) (bbi) Mud Vol (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Acl) (bbl) Gypsum 31.0 423.15

I, _ I Tax 1.0 95.94
Air Data Job Supplies

Parasite ACFM (fts/min) Drillpipe ACFM (ft3Ïmin) ECD Bil (Ib/gal) ECD Parasile (Ïb/gaÍ) Suplify ÏÏ rn Description ÜnilLat eÏ
l i i i l

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Total Received Total Consumed Total Returned

gis injected down Parasite (gal) gis Injected in ÑÍud(gal) gls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal)
Diesel Fuel Consumption

Date Consumed
Drill Strings
BHA #1, Vertical Assy.
Bil Run DrillBit lADC Bit Dull TFA (Incl Noz) (In')

1 7 7/Bin, FX55M, 11404114 | 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD 1.18
Nozzles (/32") String Length (ff) tring Wi (10DDIbf) BHA ROP (It

16/16/16/16/16/16 6.143.47 135 59.9
Drill String Components

max
Lobe Bil-Bend fL mingpm gpm

Jts item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN
1 ÑÏudMotor 6 1/2 29.18
1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.26

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 DrillPipe 4 4,964.40

Drilling Parameters
ÑoÍlBoe Slart (ftKB) ÍÔpi6 EM iÏËiÏB ineihil DrillTime (hrs) Cum DrillTime . Inl ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 365.0 | 1,913.0 | 1,548.00 19.50 19.50 79.4 440
Hole |
WOB (1000lbt) RPM (rpml SPP (psi) Rot HL (100Ölbf)PU HL (1000\bf) SO HL (1000\bf) Drilling Torqúe Off 8tm Tq

O (g ir I (31 Motor RP rpm) T (in;

FOO
P

(BTAnn6)
. T (b )(°F)

6
(surfAnn).

T4(surf
ann)

5 r0n)
(g ..

04

RECEIVED April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repon Report Date: 407/2010
Report #: 3, DFS: 0.8 i

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,548
API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD Slale AFE Number Total AFE Arnount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 T5S-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spudna Rig Release Dale KB·Ground Dislance (ft) Ground Elevation (ftKB) Daily Cost Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 32.561 98,642
Operations at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
Drilling 7 7/8" hole @ 1913' Drill7 7/8" hole. 919 919
Operations Summary Depth Start (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)
Picked up BHA, Tagged cmt. @292', Clean out cmt., drilled plug,baffle,shoe track & formation fl 365' to 365 1,913
1913' Depth Starl (TVD) (ftKB) Deplh End (TVD) (ftKB)

Remarks 365 1,913
Held PJSM w/ Crews. Targel Formation Target Depth (ftKB)

Wealher emperature (°F) Road Condilion Hole Condition Wasatch 5.946
Clear

,
39.0 Dusty Good Daily Contacts

Last Casing Set Job Contact | Mobile

Casing Description ŠetDepth (flKB) OD (in) Commenl Kini D. Gril¿. 281-605-2103
Surface 365 Pre-set Rigs

Contraclor Rig Number
Time Log Frontier 5

: Slart Time | End Time Dur (hrs) | Operation Comment
06:00 07:30 1.50lTrips P/U BHA tag cement @292, Mud Pumpo

# 2, Gardner-Denverg807:30 08:00 0,50 Miscellaneous Install rotating head rubber _ _ Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameler (m} S Lenglh (m)
08:00 10:00 2.00 DrillOut Cement/Retainers Drillout cement, plug, baffle @ 324' , shoe 800.0 7.99

track & shoe @ 365' Liner Size (in) VoltSik ÒR (bbitstk)

10:00 17:00 7.00 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole w/ 350-450 gpm, 60 rpm, 6 1/2 3 280
12-16k wob. @ 1-200 fph. PFessure (pii) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Elf (%)

17:00 17:30 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig service & adjust brakes. No ! |

17:30 06:00 12.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 941' to 1913'wl 350-450 # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
gpm, 60 rpm, 16-18k wob. @ 1-200 fph. Pump Rati (hp) Rod Diameter(in) Stroke Len9gth(in)

Mud Checks Liner Size (in) VollŠtk OR (bbl/stk)

,Type Time Depth (ftKB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/ql) PV Calc (cp) Yield Point (Ibf/100ft2 6 1/2 3.280
Water Base 05:00 940.0 8.50 29 1.000 Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Elf (%)

IGel (10s) (Ibf/100 . Gel (10m) (Ibf/10... Gel (30m) (ibf/10. . Filtrate (mL/30min) Filter Cake (/32") pl| Solids (%) 1,000.0 | No 70 95
1.000 11.0 0.7 Mud Additive Amounts

MBT (Ib/bbl) Percent Oil (%) PercenI Water {%) Chlorides mg/L) Calcium (rng)L KCL (%) Eleclric Stab (V) Description Consumed I Daily Cosl

99.3 8,000.000 0.100 Engineering 1.0 400.00
CFC for Cullings Whole Mud Add (bbl) Mud Losi lo Hole (bbl) Mud Losl (Surf) (bbi) Mud Vol (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Acl) (bbl) Gypsum 31.0 423.15

I, _ I Tax 1.0 95.94
Air Data Job Supplies

Parasite ACFM (fts/min) Drillpipe ACFM (ft3Ïmin) ECD Bil (Ib/gal) ECD Parasile (Ïb/gaÍ) Suplify ÏÏ rn Description ÜnilLat eÏ
l i i i l

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Total Received Total Consumed Total Returned

gis injected down Parasite (gal) gis Injected in ÑÍud(gal) gls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal)

Diesel Fuel Consumption
Date Consumed

Drill Strings
BHA #1, Vertical Assy.
Bil Run DrillBit lADC Bit Dull TFA (Incl Noz) (In')

1 7 7/Bin, FX55M, 11404114 | 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD 1.18
Nozzles (/32") String Length (ff) tring Wi (10DDIbf) BHA ROP (It

16/16/16/16/16/16 6.143.47 135 59.9
Drill String Components

max
Lobe Bil-Bend fL mingpm gpm

Jts item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN
1 ÑÏudMotor 6 1/2 29.18
1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.26

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 DrillPipe 4 4,964.40

Drilling Parameters
ÑoÍlBoe Slart (ftKB) ÍÔpi6 EM iÏËiÏB ineihil DrillTime (hrs) Cum DrillTime . Inl ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 365.0 | 1,913.0 | 1,548.00 19.50 19.50 79.4 440
Hole |
WOB (1000lbt) RPM (rpml SPP (psi) Rot HL (100Ölbf)PU HL (1000\bf) SO HL (1000\bf) Drilling Torqúe Off 8tm Tq

O (g ir I (31 Motor RP rpm) T (in;

FOO
P

(BTAnn6)
. T (b )(°F)

6
(surfAnn).

T4(surf
ann)

5 r0n)
(g ..

04
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April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/17/2010 ,

Report #: 3, DFS: 0.8
Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,548

. Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Anm iDaio Description EWrie In inclin MD Tie in (it NSTie in TVDTie in (fi
0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00 ] 0.00 0.00 0.00

Survey_Data
MD((IKB) Incl(*) Azin("} TVD(ItWB) NS(fi) EW(It) VS(fi} DLS(9100ft)

425.00 0.26 185.23 425.00 -0.96 -0.09 -0 96 0.06
551.00 0.13 51.73 551.00 -1.16 0.00 -1.16 0.29
767.00 0.52 57.09 766.99 -0.47 1.01 -0.47 0.18

| 983.00 0.22 17.44 982.99 0.46 1.96 0.46 0.17
1,199.00, 0.40 271.20 1,198.99 0.87 1.33 0.87 0.23
1,389.00 0.50 233.40 1,388.98 0.39 0.00 0.39 0.16
1,578.00 0.40 214.00 1,577.98 -0.65.

-1.03 -0.65 0.10
1.800.00 0.60 237.40. 1,799.97 -1.92 -2.44 -1.92 0.13

I

I

I
I

I
i

|

|

|
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Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,548

. Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Anm iDaio Description EWrie In inclin MD Tie in (it NSTie in TVDTie in (fi
0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00 ] 0.00 0.00 0.00

Survey_Data
MD((IKB) Incl(*) Azin("} TVD(ItWB) NS(fi) EW(It) VS(fi} DLS(9100ft)

425.00 0.26 185.23 425.00 -0.96 -0.09 -0 96 0.06
551.00 0.13 51.73 551.00 -1.16 0.00 -1.16 0.29
767.00 0.52 57.09 766.99 -0.47 1.01 -0.47 0.18

| 983.00 0.22 17.44 982.99 0.46 1.96 0.46 0.17
1,199.00, 0.40 271.20 1,198.99 0.87 1.33 0.87 0.23
1,389.00 0.50 233.40 1,388.98 0.39 0.00 0.39 0.16
1,578.00 0.40 214.00 1,577.98 -0.65.

-1.03 -0.65 0.10
1.800.00 0.60 237.40. 1,799.97 -1.92 -2.44 -1.92 0.13

I

I

I
I

I
i

|

|

|

RECEIVED April 26, 2010
¯



April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/18/2010
Report #: 4, DFS: 1.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,518
APllUWI Surface Legal t.ocaton Spad Dale Notice IAPD Stale AFE Numt>er Total AFE Amount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Rig Release Dale KB-Ground Distance (ft) Ground Elevation (ftKB) Daily Cost Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM i 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 22,240 120,882
Operalions at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost ÌMud Addilive Cost To Date
Drilling 7 7/8" hole @ 3431' Drill7 7/8" hole. 3,699 4,618
Operalions Summary ÖsýthŠlari(iiRif Depth End (ftKB)
Drilled 7 7/8" hole f/ 1913' to 3431' 1,913 3,431
Remarks Depth Slart (TVD) (ftKB) Depth End (TVD) (flKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews. Safely unloaded 140 joints 5 1/2" casing. 1,913 3,430
Wealhet Temperalute CF) ÏRoad CondiÏion Hole Condition Targel Formation Target Deplh (flKB)
PC 36.0 (Dusty Good Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set Daily Contacts

I Casing Descnption Set Depth (ftKB) OD (in) Comment Job Conlact Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz [281-605-2103

RigsTime Lo9 |Contractor F gNumber
Start Time End Time Dur (hrst I Operallon Comment | Frontier 506:00 13:30 7.50 Drilling Drill77/8" hole fl 1913' to 254Tw/ 440 gpm,

60 rpm, 16-18k wob. @ 1-200 fph. Mud Pumps
# 2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

i 13:30 14:00 i 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig Service Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameier (in) Stroke Length (In)
14:00 00:30 10.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 2547' to 3211'wl 440 gpm, 800.0 7.99

60 rpm, 16-18k wob. @ 35-90 fph- Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/stk)
00:30 01:00 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig Service 6 1/2 3.280
01:00 06:00 5.00 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 3211' to 3431'wl 440 gprn, Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

60 rpm, 16-18k wob. @ 35-75 fph. 1,250.0 No 70
,

95
# 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

: Mud CheckS Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) (Stroke Length (in)

Type Time Depth (ftKBT Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/ql) PV Calc (cp) Yield Point (Ibf/100fF) 800.0 | 7.99
Water Base 05:00 2,714.0 8.45 27 1.000 Liner Size (in) VollSlk ON(bbl/stk)
Get (10sMIbf100.. Gel (10m) (ibfl10 Gei (30m) (Ibf/10 Fillrate (mU30min) Filter Cake (/32") pH Solids (%) | 6 1/2 3.280

9.8 0.3 IPressure (psi) |Slow Spd Strokes (spm) |Eff (%)
MBT (Ib/bbl) Percent Oil (%) Percent Water (%) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electric Stab (V) 1,250.0 j No 70 | 95

99.7 7,800.000 720.000 Mud Additive Amounts
CE C for Cullmgs Whole Mud Add (bbi) Mud Lost Io Hole (bbl} Mud Lost (Surf) (bbl) Mud Vol (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Act) (bbl) Description Consuined Daily Cosl

| | | ! Busan 1.0 306.80
Air Data Caustic Soda 2.0 51.76

Engineering 1.0 400.00
Parasite ACFM (ft3/min) Drillpipe ACFM (ft3/min) ECD Bit (Ib/gal) ECD Parasile (Ib/gal) Gypsum 10.0 136.50

Lime 2.0 15.60
Corrosion Inhibitor injected in 24hr Period New Armor C-335-P 1.0 858.00

igls Injected down Parasite (gal) gls Injecled in Mud (gal) gls Biocide Injecled in Mud (gal)
Oxygen Scavenger 1.0 800.80
MC 122

Drill Strings Pallets 14.0 350.00
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Sea Mud 22.0 278.96
Bit Run Dnll Bit lAOCBil Dull |TFA (incl Noz) (in') Shrink Wrap 14.0 350.00

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD ] 1.18 Tax 1.0 95.94
Nozzles (/32") $iringLengi (fi) ŠlfÏng\ÑI ÖÕ0ÕIbÏ)$ÏiA R0P (it . Walnut Shell M 3.0 54.6016/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9

Job SuppliesDrill String Components
max

Lobe Bit-Bend ft min gpm gpm Supply Item Description Unil Label
Jts Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN

1IMud Motor 6 1/2 29.18 ToÏalReceived Total Consumed Total Roturned

1 Pony NMDC i 6 1/2 9.80
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41 Diesel Fuel Consumption
1.Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63 Date Consumed

6]Drill Collar 6 1/2 182.26
30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85

1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94
: 157 DrillPipe 4[ 4,964.40

IDrilling Parameters
Wellbore Slarl (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB) Cum Depth (ft) DrillTime (hrs) Cum DrillTime . Int ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 1,913.0 3,431.0 3,066.00 23.00 42.50 66.0 440
Hole
WOB (1000Ibt) RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Rol HL (10001bf) PU HL (i0Ó0lbf)SO HL (iBOOlbf) Drilling Torque Off Btm Tq

20 60 1,250.0 82 84 | 81 6.500.0 5,500.0
IQ (g in]) (flai... Motor RPM (rpm) T (Inj) (°F) IP (BH Ann) (. T (bh) (°F) P(Surf Änn)... T (surf ann) . . 0 II(q riin) (g... Q (i reÏurn)..
| 85 440.00
Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim Date DescÌiption |E1Ñfiekr.. [Inclà MD Ïie 15 ((I NSile in ÌŸÖÌiein (N..
0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0,00 | 0.00 0.00 0.00 | 0.00
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Lime 2.0 15.60
Corrosion Inhibitor injected in 24hr Period New Armor C-335-P 1.0 858.00

igls Injected down Parasite (gal) gls Injecled in Mud (gal) gls Biocide Injecled in Mud (gal)
Oxygen Scavenger 1.0 800.80
MC 122

Drill Strings Pallets 14.0 350.00
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Sea Mud 22.0 278.96
Bit Run Dnll Bit lAOCBil Dull |TFA (incl Noz) (in') Shrink Wrap 14.0 350.00

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD ] 1.18 Tax 1.0 95.94
Nozzles (/32") $iringLengi (fi) ŠlfÏng\ÑI ÖÕ0ÕIbÏ)$ÏiA R0P (it . Walnut Shell M 3.0 54.6016/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9

Job SuppliesDrill String Components
max

Lobe Bit-Bend ft min gpm gpm Supply Item Description Unil Label
Jts Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN

1IMud Motor 6 1/2 29.18 ToÏalReceived Total Consumed Total Roturned

1 Pony NMDC i 6 1/2 9.80
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41 Diesel Fuel Consumption
1.Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63 Date Consumed

6]Drill Collar 6 1/2 182.26
30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85

1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94
: 157 DrillPipe 4[ 4,964.40

IDrilling Parameters
Wellbore Slarl (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB) Cum Depth (ft) DrillTime (hrs) Cum DrillTime . Int ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 1,913.0 3,431.0 3,066.00 23.00 42.50 66.0 440
Hole
WOB (1000Ibt) RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Rol HL (10001bf) PU HL (i0Ó0lbf)SO HL (iBOOlbf) Drilling Torque Off Btm Tq

20 60 1,250.0 82 84 | 81 6.500.0 5,500.0
IQ (g in]) (flai... Motor RPM (rpm) T (Inj) (°F) IP (BH Ann) (. T (bh) (°F) P(Surf Änn)... T (surf ann) . . 0 II(q riin) (g... Q (i reÏurn)..
| 85 440.00
Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim Date DescÌiption |E1Ñfiekr.. [Inclà MD Ïie 15 ((I NSile in ÌŸÖÌiein (N..
0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0,00 | 0.00 0.00 0.00 | 0.00

RECEIVED Apnl 26 2010



April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/18/2010
Report #: 4, DFS: 1.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,518

2,022.00 0.92 236.03 2,021.95 -3.54 -4 90 -3.54 0.14
2,244.00 1.19 217.05 2,243.91 -6.38 -7.77 -6.38 0.20
2,466.00 1.36 191.38 2,465.86 -10.80 -9.67 -10.80 0.27
2,719.00 1.71 205.53 2,716.77 -17.15 -11.89 -17.15 0.20
2,937.00 1.85 208.00 2,936.66 -23.19 -14.95 -23.19 0.07
3,161.00 2.50 202.40 3,160.50 -30.90 -18.51 -30.90 0.30
3,413.00 2 90 188.92 3,412.22 -42.28 -21.59 -42.28 0.30
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2,022.00 0.92 236.03 2,021.95 -3.54 -4 90 -3.54 0.14
2,244.00 1.19 217.05 2,243.91 -6.38 -7.77 -6.38 0.20
2,466.00 1.36 191.38 2,465.86 -10.80 -9.67 -10.80 0.27
2,719.00 1.71 205.53 2,716.77 -17.15 -11.89 -17.15 0.20
2,937.00 1.85 208.00 2,936.66 -23.19 -14.95 -23.19 0.07
3,161.00 2.50 202.40 3,160.50 -30.90 -18.51 -30.90 0.30
3,413.00 2 90 188.92 3,412.22 -42.28 -21.59 -42.28 0.30

RECEIVED April 26,

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/18/2010
Report #: 4, DFS: 1.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,518

2,022.00 0.92 236.03 2,021.95 -3.54 -4 90 -3.54 0.14
2,244.00 1.19 217.05 2,243.91 -6.38 -7.77 -6.38 0.20
2,466.00 1.36 191.38 2,465.86 -10.80 -9.67 -10.80 0.27
2,719.00 1.71 205.53 2,716.77 -17.15 -11.89 -17.15 0.20
2,937.00 1.85 208.00 2,936.66 -23.19 -14.95 -23.19 0.07
3,161.00 2.50 202.40 3,160.50 -30.90 -18.51 -30.90 0.30
3,413.00 2 90 188.92 3,412.22 -42.28 -21.59 -42.28 0.30

RECEIVED April 26,



April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Repor Date: 4/19/2010
Report #: 5, DFS: 2.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,046
API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD State AFE Number Total AFE Amounl
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Rig Release Date KB-Ground Dislance (ft) Ground ElevaÏion(ÏÏKB) Daily C6st Cum CoslTo Õate

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6.067 19,463 140,345
Operations at Report Time Operations Nexl 24 Hours

¯
Daily Mud Cost liud Ãa6ÍtweÕoslÏo Õate

Drilling 7 7/8" hole @4477' Drill 7 7/8" hole. 1,891 6,509
IOperations Summary ÒepthStart (ftKB) Deplh End (flKB)
Drilled 7 7/8" hole fl 3431' to 4477' 3,431 4,477

.Remarks Depth Start (TVD) (ftKB) Deplh End (TVD) (flKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews. 3,430 4,475
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Hole Condition Target Formation Target Deplh (ftKB)
PC 38.0 Dusty Good Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set Daily Contacts
Casmg Descoplion Sol Depth (flKB) OD þn) Commeni Job Contact i Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz |281-605-2103

RigsTime Log Contractor Rig NumberstartTime | End Time Dur (hrs) Operation Commeni Frontier 506:00 14:30 8.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 3431' to 3812'wl 440 gpm,
I 60 rpm, 16-18k wob. @ 35-75 fph. Mud Pumps

# 2 Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
14:30 15:00 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig Service Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Length (in)
15:00 06:00 15.00 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole fl 3812' to 4477' wl 440 800.0 7.99

gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @ 35-75 fph- Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbÍÏstk)
...

6 1/2 3.280
Mud Checks _ Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) (Eff (%)
Type Time Depth (flKB) Densily (Ibigal) Vis (s/41) PV Cale (cp) eld Point (Ibf/100ti') 1,450.0 i No 70 | 95
Water Base 06:00 3,961.0 8.50 27 2.000 # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Gel (10s) (Ibfl100 Get (10m) (Ibl/10 Gel (30m) (tbf/10 Filtrale (mL/30min) Filler Cake (/32") pH Solids I%) Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Length (in)

9.5 1.2 800.0 7.99
MDT (Ibibbi Percent Oil (%) IPorceni Water (%) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (% Elecinc Slab (V) l.iner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/stk)

98.8 11,000.000 960.000 2 6 1/2 3.280
CEC for Cüllings Whole Mud Add (bbl) Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Los! {Surf) (bbij Mud Vol (Res) (bb1) Mud Voi (Act) (bbl) Pressure (psi) ŠlowSpd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

i I i i 1,450.0 No 70 95
Air Data ------ -- Mud Additive Amount?

Description Consumed Daily Cost
Parasile ACFM (ft'Imin) Drillpipe ACFM (ft=lmin) ECD Bit (Ib/gal) ECD Parasile (Ib/gal) Caustic Soda 2.0 51.76

I I Fngineering 1.0 400.00
Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Avpsiim 30.0 409.50gls Injected down Parasile (gal) gls Injected in Mud (gal) gls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal) Lime 2.0 15.60

Salt Gel 17.0 153.00,
Drlll Strings Sea Mud 46.0 583.28
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Tax 1.0 95.94
Bit Run Dnll Bil IADC Bil Dull TFA (incl Noz) (in2) Walnut Shell M 10.0 182.00

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD I 1.18
Nozzles (/32") IString Leng1h (ft) SiringWI 1600Ibi BHA RÖPilt .

Job Supplies
16/16/16/16/16/16 | 6,143.47 135 | 59.9

L 1 Supply item Description |Unit Label
Drill String Components

max Ïot ÏF ääeÑe2 TolaÏConsumed Total Returried
Lobe Bil-Bend fL min gpm gpm

Jis | llem Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rprn/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN
i lMud Motor 6 1/2 29.18 Diesel Fuel Consumption
1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80 Date | Consumed

1.NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.26

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 Drill Pipe 4 4,964.40
Drilling Parameters
Wellbore Start (ftKB) Depth End (flKB) um Depih (fi) Drill Time (hrs) Cum DrillTime Int ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 3,431.0 4,477.0 4,112.00 23.50 I 66.00 44.5 440
Hole
WOB (1000]bf) RPM (rpm) 'SPP (p3L) )Roi HL (10001bf) PU HL (1000Ibf) SÖHL (10001bf) Drilling Torque Off B1mTq

22 60 1.250.0 [ 82 84 81 6,500.0 5,500.0
Q (g inj) (ft*/... Motor RPM (rpm) T (Inj) (°F) P fŠH Ann) ( T (bh) ("F) P(Sud Ann) . T (suà ann} . . Q (liq rirn) (g Õ (g return) .

85 440.00
Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim... Date Descnplion EVVTieIn... Inclin D Tie In (fL.. NSTie In .. DTie In (ft ..

0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Survey Data

MD (ftKB) Inci (°) Azm (') WD (itKS) NS (ft) I EW (fi) VS (fi} DLS( 1100ft)
3,635.00 2.60 192.10 3,633.97| -52.75 -23.52 -52.75 0.15
3,954.00 2.50 198.80 3,952.65 -66.41 -27.27 -66.41 0.10

RECEIVED April 26,
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.Remarks Depth Start (TVD) (ftKB) Deplh End (TVD) (flKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews. 3,430 4,475
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Hole Condition Target Formation Target Deplh (ftKB)
PC 38.0 Dusty Good Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set Daily Contacts
Casmg Descoplion Sol Depth (flKB) OD þn) Commeni Job Contact i Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz |281-605-2103

RigsTime Log Contractor Rig NumberstartTime | End Time Dur (hrs) Operation Commeni Frontier 506:00 14:30 8.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 3431' to 3812'wl 440 gpm,
I 60 rpm, 16-18k wob. @ 35-75 fph. Mud Pumps

# 2 Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
14:30 15:00 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig Service Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Length (in)
15:00 06:00 15.00 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole fl 3812' to 4477' wl 440 800.0 7.99

gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @ 35-75 fph- Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbÍÏstk)
...

6 1/2 3.280
Mud Checks _ Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) (Eff (%)
Type Time Depth (flKB) Densily (Ibigal) Vis (s/41) PV Cale (cp) eld Point (Ibf/100ti') 1,450.0 i No 70 | 95
Water Base 06:00 3,961.0 8.50 27 2.000 # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Gel (10s) (Ibfl100 Get (10m) (Ibl/10 Gel (30m) (tbf/10 Filtrale (mL/30min) Filler Cake (/32") pH Solids I%) Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Length (in)

9.5 1.2 800.0 7.99
MDT (Ibibbi Percent Oil (%) IPorceni Water (%) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (% Elecinc Slab (V) l.iner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/stk)

98.8 11,000.000 960.000 2 6 1/2 3.280
CEC for Cüllings Whole Mud Add (bbl) Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Los! {Surf) (bbij Mud Vol (Res) (bb1) Mud Voi (Act) (bbl) Pressure (psi) ŠlowSpd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

i I i i 1,450.0 No 70 95
Air Data ------ -- Mud Additive Amount?

Description Consumed Daily Cost
Parasile ACFM (ft'Imin) Drillpipe ACFM (ft=lmin) ECD Bit (Ib/gal) ECD Parasile (Ib/gal) Caustic Soda 2.0 51.76

I I Fngineering 1.0 400.00
Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Avpsiim 30.0 409.50gls Injected down Parasile (gal) gls Injected in Mud (gal) gls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal) Lime 2.0 15.60

Salt Gel 17.0 153.00,
Drlll Strings Sea Mud 46.0 583.28
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Tax 1.0 95.94
Bit Run Dnll Bil IADC Bil Dull TFA (incl Noz) (in2) Walnut Shell M 10.0 182.00

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD I 1.18
Nozzles (/32") IString Leng1h (ft) SiringWI 1600Ibi BHA RÖPilt .

Job Supplies
16/16/16/16/16/16 | 6,143.47 135 | 59.9

L 1 Supply item Description |Unit Label
Drill String Components

max Ïot ÏF ääeÑe2 TolaÏConsumed Total Returried
Lobe Bil-Bend fL min gpm gpm

Jis | llem Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rprn/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN
i lMud Motor 6 1/2 29.18 Diesel Fuel Consumption
1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80 Date | Consumed

1.NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.26

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 Drill Pipe 4 4,964.40
Drilling Parameters
Wellbore Start (ftKB) Depth End (flKB) um Depih (fi) Drill Time (hrs) Cum DrillTime Int ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 3,431.0 4,477.0 4,112.00 23.50 I 66.00 44.5 440
Hole
WOB (1000]bf) RPM (rpm) 'SPP (p3L) )Roi HL (10001bf) PU HL (1000Ibf) SÖHL (10001bf) Drilling Torque Off B1mTq

22 60 1.250.0 [ 82 84 81 6,500.0 5,500.0
Q (g inj) (ft*/... Motor RPM (rpm) T (Inj) (°F) P fŠH Ann) ( T (bh) ("F) P(Sud Ann) . T (suà ann} . . Q (liq rirn) (g Õ (g return) .

85 440.00
Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim... Date Descnplion EVVTieIn... Inclin D Tie In (fL.. NSTie In .. DTie In (ft ..

0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Survey Data

MD (ftKB) Inci (°) Azm (') WD (itKS) NS (ft) I EW (fi) VS (fi} DLS( 1100ft)
3,635.00 2.60 192.10 3,633.97| -52.75 -23.52 -52.75 0.15
3,954.00 2.50 198.80 3,952.65 -66.41 -27.27 -66.41 0.10

RECEIVED April 26,

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Repor Date: 4/19/2010
Report #: 5, DFS: 2.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,046
API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD State AFE Number Total AFE Amounl
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Rig Release Date KB-Ground Dislance (ft) Ground ElevaÏion(ÏÏKB) Daily C6st Cum CoslTo Õate

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6.067 19,463 140,345
Operations at Report Time Operations Nexl 24 Hours

¯
Daily Mud Cost liud Ãa6ÍtweÕoslÏo Õate

Drilling 7 7/8" hole @4477' Drill 7 7/8" hole. 1,891 6,509
IOperations Summary ÒepthStart (ftKB) Deplh End (flKB)
Drilled 7 7/8" hole fl 3431' to 4477' 3,431 4,477

.Remarks Depth Start (TVD) (ftKB) Deplh End (TVD) (flKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews. 3,430 4,475
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condition Hole Condition Target Formation Target Deplh (ftKB)
PC 38.0 Dusty Good Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set Daily Contacts
Casmg Descoplion Sol Depth (flKB) OD þn) Commeni Job Contact i Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz |281-605-2103

Rigs
Time Log Contractor Rig NumberstartTime | End Time Dur (hrs) Operation Commeni Frontier 5
06:00 14:30 8.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 3431' to 3812'wl 440 gpm,

I 60 rpm, 16-18k wob. @ 35-75 fph. Mud Pumps
# 2 Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

14:30 15:00 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig Service Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Length (in)
15:00 06:00 15.00 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole fl 3812' to 4477' wl 440 800.0 7.99

gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @ 35-75 fph- Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbÍÏstk)
...

6 1/2 3.280
Mud Checks _ Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) (Eff (%)
Type Time Depth (flKB) Densily (Ibigal) Vis (s/41) PV Cale (cp) eld Point (Ibf/100ti') 1,450.0 i No 70 | 95
Water Base 06:00 3,961.0 8.50 27 2.000 # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Gel (10s) (Ibfl100 Get (10m) (Ibl/10 Gel (30m) (tbf/10 Filtrale (mL/30min) Filler Cake (/32") pH Solids I%) Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Length (in)

9.5 1.2 800.0 7.99
MDT (Ibibbi Percent Oil (%) IPorceni Water (%) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (% Elecinc Slab (V) l.iner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/stk)

98.8 11,000.000 960.000 2 6 1/2 3.280
CEC for Cüllings Whole Mud Add (bbl) Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Los! {Surf) (bbij Mud Vol (Res) (bb1) Mud Voi (Act) (bbl) Pressure (psi) ŠlowSpd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

i I i i 1,450.0 No 70 95
Air Data ------ -- Mud Additive Amount?

Description Consumed Daily Cost
Parasile ACFM (ft'Imin) Drillpipe ACFM (ft=lmin) ECD Bit (Ib/gal) ECD Parasile (Ib/gal) Caustic Soda 2.0 51.76

I I Fngineering 1.0 400.00
Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Avpsiim 30.0 409.50gls Injected down Parasile (gal) gls Injected in Mud (gal) gls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal)

Lime 2.0 15.60
Salt Gel 17.0 153.00,

Drlll Strings Sea Mud 46.0 583.28
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Tax 1.0 95.94
Bit Run Dnll Bil IADC Bil Dull TFA (incl Noz) (in2) Walnut Shell M 10.0 182.00

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD I 1.18
Nozzles (/32") IString Leng1h (ft) SiringWI 1600Ibi BHA RÖPilt .

Job Supplies
16/16/16/16/16/16 | 6,143.47 135 | 59.9

L 1 Supply item Description |Unit Label
Drill String Components

max Ïot ÏF ääeÑe2 TolaÏConsumed Total Returried
Lobe Bil-Bend fL min gpm gpm

Jis | llem Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rprn/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN
i lMud Motor 6 1/2 29.18 Diesel Fuel Consumption
1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80 Date | Consumed

1.NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.26

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 Drill Pipe 4 4,964.40

Drilling Parameters
Wellbore Start (ftKB) Depth End (flKB) um Depih (fi) Drill Time (hrs) Cum DrillTime Int ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 3,431.0 4,477.0 4,112.00 23.50 I 66.00 44.5 440
Hole
WOB (1000]bf) RPM (rpm) 'SPP (p3L) )Roi HL (10001bf) PU HL (1000Ibf) SÖHL (10001bf) Drilling Torque Off B1mTq

22 60 1.250.0 [ 82 84 81 6,500.0 5,500.0
Q (g inj) (ft*/... Motor RPM (rpm) T (Inj) (°F) P fŠH Ann) ( T (bh) ("F) P(Sud Ann) . T (suà ann} . . Q (liq rirn) (g Õ (g return) .

85 440.00
Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim... Date Descnplion EVVTieIn... Inclin D Tie In (fL.. NSTie In .. DTie In (ft ..

0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Survey Data

MD (ftKB) Inci (°) Azm (') WD (itKS) NS (ft) I EW (fi) VS (fi} DLS( 1100ft)
3,635.00 2.60 192.10 3,633.97| -52.75 -23.52 -52.75 0.15
3,954.00 2.50 198.80 3,952.65 -66.41 -27.27 -66.41 0.10

RECEIVED April 26,



April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repon Report Date: 4/19/2010
Report #: 5, DFS: 2.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,046
Survey Data

MD ftKB) Incl {*} '
Azm P) | ÑD ÏfKŠ ÑŠ(ft) Ew (fl] , VS (ft) | OLS (1100ft)

4,079.001 3.00 207.20 4.077.51 -71.90 -29.65 -71.90 0.51
4,300.00 2.90 206.90[ 4,298.21 -82.03

-34.82 -82.03 0.05
I

I
I

I

i

I

I

I
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Survey Data

MD ftKB) Incl {*} '
Azm P) | ÑD ÏfKŠ ÑŠ(ft) Ew (fl] , VS (ft) | OLS (1100ft)

4,079.001 3.00 207.20 4.077.51 -71.90 -29.65 -71.90 0.51
4,300.00 2.90 206.90[ 4,298.21 -82.03

-34.82 -82.03 0.05
I

I
I

I

i

I

I

I

RECEIVED April 26,



April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/20/2010
Report #: 6, DFS: 3.8 i

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,287 I

API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD State AFE Number Total AFE Amount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 T5S-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885 1
Spud Dato Rig Release Date KB-Ground Distance (ft) Ground Elevation (ftKB) Daily Cosl Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 21.501 161,846
Operations al Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cosl WIudAddillve Cost To Date
Drilling 7 7/8" hole @ 5764' Drill to TD @ +/- 6090' L/D DP, Log well, RIH w/ 5 1,698 8,207

1/2" Production casing, Depth Siait (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)

operalianssummary 4,477 5,764
Drilled 7 7/8" hole f/ 4477' to 5764' oepthSlart (TVD) (ftKB) Depth End (TVD) (ftKB)

Remarks 4,475 5,761
Held PJSM w/ CreWS, Target Formation Target Depth (flKB)

Weather Temperature (°F) [Road Condition Hole ÖoncÍÏifen Wasatch 5,946
Clear . 40.0 |Dusty Good Daily Contacts
Last Casing Set Job Contact Mobile

Casing Description Set Deplh (flKB) OD (in) Comment
¯ Kim D. Gritz 281-605-2103

Surface 365 Pre-set Rigs
Contractor Rig Number

Time Log Frontier 5
Start Time End Time (hrs) Operation Comment MUdO Jmp06:00 14:30 | 8.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 4477' to 4767' w/ 440

| gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @35-75 fph. 2m'pRGanrd q
am tr (n) troke Length (In)

14:30 15:00 ' 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig Service 800.0
LR S

15:00 06:00 15.00 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 4677' to 5764' w/ 440 Liner Size (in) VollŠtiOR (bblÏsÏk)
gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @ 45-125 fph 6 1/2 3.280

. I
Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

Mud Checks 1,600.0 No 70 | 95
aeter

Base
Time

18:45
Depth5,046.0

8
lb/gal) Vis (s/ql PV Calc (cp Yield Point bü100ft # 1, Gaardnper-Deno

D mlr (n) Stroke Length (in)
Gel (iOs) (Ibf/100 el (10m) (Ibf/10... Gel (30m) (Ibf/10. Fillrale (mLl30min) Filter Cake (/32") pH Solids (%) 800.0 7.99

10.1 0.1 Liner Size (in)
¯

Vol/Stk OR (bbl/slk)
MBT (Ib/bbl) Percent Oil (%) Percent Water (%) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electnc Stab (V) 6 1/2 3.280

99.9 11,200.000 600.000 2 Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
CEC for Cuttings \ÑholeMud Add (bbi) Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Ï.osÏ(Surf) (bbl) Mud Vol (Pses) (bbl) MudÑol(Acl) (bbÍ) 1,600.0 No 70 95

i Mud Additivo .n.mounte

Air Data Description Consumed Daily Cost
austic Soda 4.0 103.52|

Parasite ACFM (ft3/min) Drillpipe ACFM (ft'Imin) ECD Bit (Ib/gai) ECD Parasite (Ib/gal) Engineering 1.0 400.00
I I ,C,ypolim 24.0 327.60

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Il ime 3.0 23.40
gis injected down Parasite (gal) gls injected in Mud (gal) gis Biocide injected in Mud (gal) Salt Gel 42.0 378.00

Gawdust 11.0 60.28
Drill Strings Tax 1.0 95.94
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Walnut Shell M 17.0 309.40
Bit Run Drill Bil lADC Bit Dull TFA {mctNoz) (ini Job Supplies

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD | 1.18
.Nozzles (/32") String Length (ft) String Wt (1000tbf) BHA ROP (ft Supply llem Description Unit Label

16/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9
Drill String Components 10tal Received Total Consumed Total Returned

max
I Lobe Bit-Bend ft mingpm gpm

i Jts Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN DIOSei Fuel Consumption
1 Mud Motor 6 1/2 29.18 i Date | Consumed

, 1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 Drill Collar 6 1/2 182.26 i

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 DrillPipe 4 4,964.40
. Drilling Parameters

Wallbore ISlari (ItKB) Depili End (ItKB) ICum Depth (ft) DrillTime (hrs) Cum Drill Time . Int ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 4,477.0 5,764.0 5,399.00 23.50 89.50 54.8 440
Hole
Wort (1000tbt) RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Rol HL (1000Ibf) PU HL (1000\bf) S0 i L (1000tiff Driiiing Torque ÚlfStm i q

22 60 1,600.0 113 116 108 7,500.0 6,000.0
Q (g inj) (fPI . Motor RPM (rpm) T (inj) ("F) P (BH Ann) (... T (bh) (°F) P(Surf Ann) .. T (surf ann) ... Q Ii rtrn})g., O (g eturn)

85 440.00
Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim . Date Description EWDe In.. Inclin MD Tle10 (It NSTie in T TD¾ein fi
0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00

,
0.00 0.00 0.00

Survey Data
MD (itKB) Incl ( ) Azm ( ) I TVD (ftKB) NS (ft) | EW (ft) | VS (ft) | DLS ( /100ft)

4,553.00 2.68 203.69| 4,550.92 -93 16 -40 09 -93.16 0.11

RECEIVED Apnl 26,

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/20/2010
Report #: 6, DFS: 3.8 i

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,287 I

API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD State AFE Number Total AFE Amount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 T5S-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885 1
Spud Dato Rig Release Date KB-Ground Distance (ft) Ground Elevation (ftKB) Daily Cosl Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 21.501 161,846
Operations al Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cosl WIudAddillve Cost To Date
Drilling 7 7/8" hole @ 5764' Drill to TD @ +/- 6090' L/D DP, Log well, RIH w/ 5 1,698 8,207

1/2" Production casing, Depth Siait (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)

operalianssummary 4,477 5,764
Drilled 7 7/8" hole f/ 4477' to 5764' oepthSlart (TVD) (ftKB) Depth End (TVD) (ftKB)

Remarks 4,475 5,761
Held PJSM w/ CreWS, Target Formation Target Depth (flKB)

Weather Temperature (°F) [Road Condition Hole ÖoncÍÏifen Wasatch 5,946
Clear . 40.0 |Dusty Good Daily Contacts
Last Casing Set Job Contact Mobile

Casing Description Set Deplh (flKB) OD (in) Comment
¯ Kim D. Gritz 281-605-2103

Surface 365 Pre-set Rigs
Contractor Rig Number

Time Log Frontier 5
Start Time End Time (hrs) Operation Comment MUdO Jmp06:00 14:30 | 8.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 4477' to 4767' w/ 440

| gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @35-75 fph. 2m'pRGanrd q
am tr (n) troke Length (In)

14:30 15:00 ' 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig Service 800.0
LR S

15:00 06:00 15.00 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 4677' to 5764' w/ 440 Liner Size (in) VollŠtiOR (bblÏsÏk)
gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @ 45-125 fph 6 1/2 3.280

. I
Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

Mud Checks 1,600.0 No 70 | 95
aeter

Base
Time

18:45
Depth5,046.0

8
lb/gal) Vis (s/ql PV Calc (cp Yield Point bü100ft # 1, Gaardnper-Deno

D mlr (n) Stroke Length (in)
Gel (iOs) (Ibf/100 el (10m) (Ibf/10... Gel (30m) (Ibf/10. Fillrale (mLl30min) Filter Cake (/32") pH Solids (%) 800.0 7.99

10.1 0.1 Liner Size (in)
¯

Vol/Stk OR (bbl/slk)
MBT (Ib/bbl) Percent Oil (%) Percent Water (%) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electnc Stab (V) 6 1/2 3.280

99.9 11,200.000 600.000 2 Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
CEC for Cuttings \ÑholeMud Add (bbi) Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Ï.osÏ(Surf) (bbl) Mud Vol (Pses) (bbl) MudÑol(Acl) (bbÍ) 1,600.0 No 70 95

i Mud Additivo .n.mounte

Air Data Description Consumed Daily Cost
austic Soda 4.0 103.52|

Parasite ACFM (ft3/min) Drillpipe ACFM (ft'Imin) ECD Bit (Ib/gai) ECD Parasite (Ib/gal) Engineering 1.0 400.00
I I ,C,ypolim 24.0 327.60

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Il ime 3.0 23.40
gis injected down Parasite (gal) gls injected in Mud (gal) gis Biocide injected in Mud (gal) Salt Gel 42.0 378.00

Gawdust 11.0 60.28
Drill Strings Tax 1.0 95.94
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Walnut Shell M 17.0 309.40
Bit Run Drill Bil lADC Bit Dull TFA {mctNoz) (ini Job Supplies

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD | 1.18
.Nozzles (/32") String Length (ft) String Wt (1000tbf) BHA ROP (ft Supply llem Description Unit Label

16/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9
Drill String Components 10tal Received Total Consumed Total Returned

max
I Lobe Bit-Bend ft mingpm gpm

i Jts Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN DIOSei Fuel Consumption
1 Mud Motor 6 1/2 29.18 i Date | Consumed

, 1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 Drill Collar 6 1/2 182.26 i

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 DrillPipe 4 4,964.40
. Drilling Parameters

Wallbore ISlari (ItKB) Depili End (ItKB) ICum Depth (ft) DrillTime (hrs) Cum Drill Time . Int ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 4,477.0 5,764.0 5,399.00 23.50 89.50 54.8 440
Hole
Wort (1000tbt) RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Rol HL (1000Ibf) PU HL (1000\bf) S0 i L (1000tiff Driiiing Torque ÚlfStm i q

22 60 1,600.0 113 116 108 7,500.0 6,000.0
Q (g inj) (fPI . Motor RPM (rpm) T (inj) ("F) P (BH Ann) (... T (bh) (°F) P(Surf Ann) .. T (surf ann) ... Q Ii rtrn})g., O (g eturn)

85 440.00
Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim . Date Description EWDe In.. Inclin MD Tle10 (It NSTie in T TD¾ein fi
0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00

,
0.00 0.00 0.00

Survey Data
MD (itKB) Incl ( ) Azm ( ) I TVD (ftKB) NS (ft) | EW (ft) | VS (ft) | DLS ( /100ft)

4,553.00 2.68 203.69| 4,550.92 -93 16 -40 09 -93.16 0.11

RECEIVED Apnl 26,

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/20/2010
Report #: 6, DFS: 3.8 i

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,287 I

API/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD State AFE Number Total AFE Amount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 T5S-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885 1
Spud Dato Rig Release Date KB-Ground Distance (ft) Ground Elevation (ftKB) Daily Cosl Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 21.501 161,846
Operations al Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cosl WIudAddillve Cost To Date
Drilling 7 7/8" hole @ 5764' Drill to TD @ +/- 6090' L/D DP, Log well, RIH w/ 5 1,698 8,207

1/2" Production casing, Depth Siait (ftKB) Depth End (ftKB)

operalianssummary 4,477 5,764
Drilled 7 7/8" hole f/ 4477' to 5764' oepthSlart (TVD) (ftKB) Depth End (TVD) (ftKB)

Remarks 4,475 5,761
Held PJSM w/ CreWS, Target Formation Target Depth (flKB)

Weather Temperature (°F) [Road Condition Hole ÖoncÍÏifen Wasatch 5,946
Clear . 40.0 |Dusty Good Daily Contacts
Last Casing Set Job Contact Mobile

Casing Description Set Deplh (flKB) OD (in) Comment
¯ Kim D. Gritz 281-605-2103

Surface 365 Pre-set Rigs
Contractor Rig Number

Time Log Frontier 5
Start Time End Time (hrs) Operation Comment MUdO Jmp06:00 14:30 | 8.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 4477' to 4767' w/ 440

| gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @35-75 fph. 2m'pRGanrd q
am tr (n) troke Length (In)

14:30 15:00 ' 0.50 Lubricate Rig Rig Service 800.0
LR S

15:00 06:00 15.00 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole f/ 4677' to 5764' w/ 440 Liner Size (in) VollŠtiOR (bblÏsÏk)
gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @ 45-125 fph 6 1/2 3.280

. I
Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

Mud Checks 1,600.0 No 70 | 95
aeter

Base
Time

18:45
Depth5,046.0

8
lb/gal) Vis (s/ql PV Calc (cp Yield Point bü100ft # 1, Gaardnper-Deno

D mlr (n) Stroke Length (in)
Gel (iOs) (Ibf/100 el (10m) (Ibf/10... Gel (30m) (Ibf/10. Fillrale (mLl30min) Filter Cake (/32") pH Solids (%) 800.0 7.99

10.1 0.1 Liner Size (in)
¯

Vol/Stk OR (bbl/slk)
MBT (Ib/bbl) Percent Oil (%) Percent Water (%) Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electnc Stab (V) 6 1/2 3.280

99.9 11,200.000 600.000 2 Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
CEC for Cuttings \ÑholeMud Add (bbi) Mud Lost to Hole (bbl) Mud Ï.osÏ(Surf) (bbl) Mud Vol (Pses) (bbl) MudÑol(Acl) (bbÍ) 1,600.0 No 70 95

i Mud Additivo .n.mounte

Air Data Description Consumed Daily Cost
austic Soda 4.0 103.52|

Parasite ACFM (ft3/min) Drillpipe ACFM (ft'Imin) ECD Bit (Ib/gai) ECD Parasite (Ib/gal) Engineering 1.0 400.00
I I ,C,ypolim 24.0 327.60

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Il ime 3.0 23.40
gis injected down Parasite (gal) gls injected in Mud (gal) gis Biocide injected in Mud (gal)

Salt Gel 42.0 378.00
Gawdust 11.0 60.28

Drill Strings Tax 1.0 95.94
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Walnut Shell M 17.0 309.40
Bit Run Drill Bil lADC Bit Dull TFA {mctNoz) (ini Job Supplies

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD | 1.18
.Nozzles (/32") String Length (ft) String Wt (1000tbf) BHA ROP (ft Supply llem Description Unit Label

16/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9
Drill String Components 10tal Received Total Consumed Total Returned

max
I Lobe Bit-Bend ft mingpm gpm

i Jts Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN DIOSei Fuel Consumption
1 Mud Motor 6 1/2 29.18 i Date | Consumed

, 1 Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80
1 NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 Drill Collar 6 1/2 182.26 i

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 DrillPipe 4 4,964.40
. Drilling Parameters

Wallbore ISlari (ItKB) Depili End (ItKB) ICum Depth (ft) DrillTime (hrs) Cum Drill Time . Int ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rate (gpm)
Original 4,477.0 5,764.0 5,399.00 23.50 89.50 54.8 440
Hole
Wort (1000tbt) RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Rol HL (1000Ibf) PU HL (1000\bf) S0 i L (1000tiff Driiiing Torque ÚlfStm i q

22 60 1,600.0 113 116 108 7,500.0 6,000.0
Q (g inj) (fPI . Motor RPM (rpm) T (inj) ("F) P (BH Ann) (... T (bh) (°F) P(Surf Ann) .. T (surf ann) ... Q Ii rtrn})g., O (g eturn)

85 440.00

Deviation Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim . Date Description EWDe In.. Inclin MD Tle10 (It NSTie in T TD¾ein fi
0.00 4/16/2010 Vertical hole 0.00 0.00

,
0.00 0.00 0.00

Survey Data
MD (itKB) Incl ( ) Azm ( ) I TVD (ftKB) NS (ft) | EW (ft) | VS (ft) | DLS ( /100ft)

4,553.00 2.68 203.69| 4,550.92 -93 16 -40 09 -93.16 0.11

RECEIVED Apnl 26,



April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/20/2010
Report #: 6, DFS: 3.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,287
Survey Data

DWe) i inei zm Tvo (nKe) _NS (N) FW (R)__ VS (n) DLS (910Dft)
4,772.00 2.81 202.19 4,769.66 -102.82 -44.18 -102.82 0.07
4,993.00 3.60 201.14 4,990.32' -114.30 -48.73 -114.30 0.36
5,213.00 1.45 140.851 5,210.12 -122.91 -49.46 -122.91 1.43
5,431.00 1.40 238.70 5,428.08 -126.43 -49.99 -126.43 0 99
5,690 00 1.30 220.70 5,687.01 -130.30 -54.61 -130.30 0.17
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I
I
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I
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I

RECEIVED Apiil 26,

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/20/2010
Report #: 6, DFS: 3.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,287
Survey Data

DWe) i inei zm Tvo (nKe) _NS (N) FW (R)__ VS (n) DLS (910Dft)
4,772.00 2.81 202.19 4,769.66 -102.82 -44.18 -102.82 0.07
4,993.00 3.60 201.14 4,990.32' -114.30 -48.73 -114.30 0.36
5,213.00 1.45 140.851 5,210.12 -122.91 -49.46 -122.91 1.43
5,431.00 1.40 238.70 5,428.08 -126.43 -49.99 -126.43 0 99
5,690 00 1.30 220.70 5,687.01 -130.30 -54.61 -130.30 0.17
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RECEIVED Apiil 26,

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/20/2010
Report #: 6, DFS: 3.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 1,287
Survey Data

DWe) i inei zm Tvo (nKe) _NS (N) FW (R)__ VS (n) DLS (910Dft)
4,772.00 2.81 202.19 4,769.66 -102.82 -44.18 -102.82 0.07
4,993.00 3.60 201.14 4,990.32' -114.30 -48.73 -114.30 0.36
5,213.00 1.45 140.851 5,210.12 -122.91 -49.46 -122.91 1.43
5,431.00 1.40 238.70 5,428.08 -126.43 -49.99 -126.43 0 99
5,690 00 1.30 220.70 5,687.01 -130.30 -54.61 -130.30 0.17
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RECEIVED Apiil 26,



April 26, 2010

- Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/21/2010
Report #: 7, DFS: 4.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 416
|APt)UWI 'Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD Slate AFE Number Total AFE Amounl
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Dale Rig Release Date RB-Ground Disiance (ft) ÕroundElevaÏiori(ÏÏK5) DaÏÏyCost CumCost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 85,317 247,163
Operations at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
Logging:re-run Baker-Atlas HDIL tool. Finish logging, Run & cernent 5 1/2"casing, rig down. 3,243 11,450
Operations Summary Deplh Start (ftKB) Depth End (flKB)
Drilled 7 7/8" hole f/ 5764' to 6180', sweep hole, L/D DP & tools, log well 5,764 6,180
Remarks Depth Slarl (TVD) (ftKB) Depth End (TVD) (ftKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews. 5,761
Wealher Temperature (°F) Road Condilion Hole Condilion Target Formation Target Depth (flKB)
PC 38.0 Dusty |Good Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set Daily Contacts
Casing Description Set Depth (flKB) OD (in) Comment Job Contact | Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz j281-605-2103

Rigs
Time Lo9 Contractor Rig Number
Slart Time I End Time Dur (hrs) Operation Comment Frontier 5
06:00 13:30 7.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole fl 5764' to 6180" w/ 440

gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @ 35-155 fph. Mud Pumps
# 2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

13:30 14:30 1.00 Condition Mud &Circulate Pump Hi Vis Sweep B/Üx 2 Pump Rating {hp) Rod Diameter (in "Siioife rintFi(i
14:30 15:00 0.50 Trips Pull & stand back 5 stands to evaluate hole I 800.0 | 7.99

cond. ( slick ) Liner Size (in) VoFIStk0R (bblistki

15:00 16:00 1.00 LD Drillpipe Rig Up Franks Westates L/D Machine.
16:00 22:00 6.00 LD Drillpipe L/D Drillpipe , HWDP , DÓs, & Directional Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

tools. No

22:00 23:00 1.00 Wire Line Logs Rig up Baker-Atlas Loggers. # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Lengtn (in)23:00 06:00 7.00 Wire Line Logs Log well wlHDIL/SP/GR,Density/Neutron' 800.0 | 7.99Re-run HDIL as per Berry Petroleum LmerSi2e(in} Vol/StkOR(bbl/slk)

Geologist request.
Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

Mud Checks No
Typo Time Depth (flKB} [Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/ql) PV Calc (cp) Yield Point (Ibf/100ft2)

iWater Base 06.00 6,180.0 | 8.45 27 1.000 Mud Additive Amounts
Gel (10s) (Ibif100.. Gel (10m) (Fbf/10 Gel (30m} (1bil10 . Fillrate (mLI30min) Filler Cake (132") pH Solids (%) Description | Consumed Daily Cost

Caustic Soda I 4.0 103.5211.0 0.1
MBT (Ib/bbl) Perconi Oil (%) Percent Waler {%) Chlorides (mg/L) |Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electric Slab (V) Dyna Fiber 5.0 98.05

99.9 10,900.000 680.000 2 Engineering 1.0 400.00
CEC for Cullings Wholo Mud Add bbl) Mud Losl lo Hole (bbi) Mud Losi (Surf) (bbl) Mud Vol (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Act) (bbl) Gypsum 23.0 313.95

i |
__ | | | KCL 42.0 756.00.

Air Data Lime 10.0 78.00
Salt Gel 35.0 315.00

Parasile ACFM (Italmin) IDalipipe ACFM (It=tmin) ECD Bil (Ibigal) ECD Parasile (Ib/gal) Sea Mud 10.0 126.80
Tax 1.0 95.94

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Triinking 1.0 828.00
gis Injected down Parasite (gal) gis Injected in Mud (gal) Jgls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal) Walnut Shell M 7.0 127.40

¯¯ Job Supplies
Drill Strings
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Supply Item Descriplion Unit Label

Bit Run Dnli Bit lADC Bil Dull TFA (incl Noz) (In')

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD 1.18 Total Received Total Consumed Total Returned

Nozzles (/32") String Length (fl) String Wt (1000lbf) BHA ROP (ft
16/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9 Diesel Fuel Consumption

Drill String Components 03te I consumed

I max
Lobe Bit-Bend ft mingpm gpm

Jls
,

Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Slages rpm/gpm (fl) (gpm) (gpm) SN
l iMud Motor i 6 1/2 29.18
1.Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80
1,NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.8

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 DrillPipe 4 4,964.40
Drilling Parameters
Wollbore ISiart (ItKB) |Depth End (flKB)lÕumDepih (ft) :Drill Time (hrs) ICum Dnil Time ...lnt ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rale (gpm)
Original 5.764.0 6,180.0 5,815.00 7.50 97.00 55.5 440
Hole

,
WOB {1000161) RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Roi HL 10001ttf) PU HL (1000FbDSO HL (10001bf) Drilling Torque Off Btm Tq

22 60 1,750.0 113 116 108 7,500.0 6,000.0
0 (g ir ¡) (il i Molor RPM (rpm T (In)) F) P BH A(LA) . T (bh) (°F) P(Surf Ann) T (surf arin) .. Q (liq rtrn) (g... Q (greturn) .

85 440.00
¯¯

ÀECEIVED April 26, 2010

- Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/21/2010
Report #: 7, DFS: 4.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 416
|APt)UWI 'Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD Slate AFE Number Total AFE Amounl
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Dale Rig Release Date RB-Ground Disiance (ft) ÕroundElevaÏiori(ÏÏK5) DaÏÏyCost CumCost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 85,317 247,163
Operations at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
Logging:re-run Baker-Atlas HDIL tool. Finish logging, Run & cernent 5 1/2"casing, rig down. 3,243 11,450
Operations Summary Deplh Start (ftKB) Depth End (flKB)
Drilled 7 7/8" hole f/ 5764' to 6180', sweep hole, L/D DP & tools, log well 5,764 6,180
Remarks Depth Slarl (TVD) (ftKB) Depth End (TVD) (ftKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews. 5,761
Wealher Temperature (°F) Road Condilion Hole Condilion Target Formation Target Depth (flKB)
PC 38.0 Dusty |Good Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set Daily Contacts
Casing Description Set Depth (flKB) OD (in) Comment Job Contact | Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz j281-605-2103

Rigs
Time Lo9 Contractor Rig Number
Slart Time I End Time Dur (hrs) Operation Comment Frontier 5
06:00 13:30 7.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole fl 5764' to 6180" w/ 440

gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @ 35-155 fph. Mud Pumps
# 2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

13:30 14:30 1.00 Condition Mud &Circulate Pump Hi Vis Sweep B/Üx 2 Pump Rating {hp) Rod Diameter (in "Siioife rintFi(i
14:30 15:00 0.50 Trips Pull & stand back 5 stands to evaluate hole I 800.0 | 7.99

cond. ( slick ) Liner Size (in) VoFIStk0R (bblistki

15:00 16:00 1.00 LD Drillpipe Rig Up Franks Westates L/D Machine.
16:00 22:00 6.00 LD Drillpipe L/D Drillpipe , HWDP , DÓs, & Directional Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

tools. No

22:00 23:00 1.00 Wire Line Logs Rig up Baker-Atlas Loggers. # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Lengtn (in)23:00 06:00 7.00 Wire Line Logs Log well wlHDIL/SP/GR,Density/Neutron' 800.0 | 7.99Re-run HDIL as per Berry Petroleum LmerSi2e(in} Vol/StkOR(bbl/slk)

Geologist request.
Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

Mud Checks No
Typo Time Depth (flKB} [Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/ql) PV Calc (cp) Yield Point (Ibf/100ft2)

iWater Base 06.00 6,180.0 | 8.45 27 1.000 Mud Additive Amounts
Gel (10s) (Ibif100.. Gel (10m) (Fbf/10 Gel (30m} (1bil10 . Fillrate (mLI30min) Filler Cake (132") pH Solids (%) Description | Consumed Daily Cost

Caustic Soda I 4.0 103.5211.0 0.1
MBT (Ib/bbl) Perconi Oil (%) Percent Waler {%) Chlorides (mg/L) |Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electric Slab (V) Dyna Fiber 5.0 98.05

99.9 10,900.000 680.000 2 Engineering 1.0 400.00
CEC for Cullings Wholo Mud Add bbl) Mud Losl lo Hole (bbi) Mud Losi (Surf) (bbl) Mud Vol (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Act) (bbl) Gypsum 23.0 313.95

i |
__ | | | KCL 42.0 756.00.

Air Data Lime 10.0 78.00
Salt Gel 35.0 315.00

Parasile ACFM (Italmin) IDalipipe ACFM (It=tmin) ECD Bil (Ibigal) ECD Parasile (Ib/gal) Sea Mud 10.0 126.80
Tax 1.0 95.94

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Triinking 1.0 828.00
gis Injected down Parasite (gal) gis Injected in Mud (gal) Jgls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal) Walnut Shell M 7.0 127.40

¯¯ Job Supplies
Drill Strings
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Supply Item Descriplion Unit Label

Bit Run Dnli Bit lADC Bil Dull TFA (incl Noz) (In')

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD 1.18 Total Received Total Consumed Total Returned

Nozzles (/32") String Length (fl) String Wt (1000lbf) BHA ROP (ft
16/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9 Diesel Fuel Consumption

Drill String Components 03te I consumed

I max
Lobe Bit-Bend ft mingpm gpm

Jls
,

Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Slages rpm/gpm (fl) (gpm) (gpm) SN
l iMud Motor i 6 1/2 29.18
1.Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80
1,NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.8

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 DrillPipe 4 4,964.40
Drilling Parameters
Wollbore ISiart (ItKB) |Depth End (flKB)lÕumDepih (ft) :Drill Time (hrs) ICum Dnil Time ...lnt ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rale (gpm)
Original 5.764.0 6,180.0 5,815.00 7.50 97.00 55.5 440
Hole

,
WOB {1000161) RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Roi HL 10001ttf) PU HL (1000FbDSO HL (10001bf) Drilling Torque Off Btm Tq

22 60 1,750.0 113 116 108 7,500.0 6,000.0
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ÀECEIVED April 26, 2010

- Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/21/2010
Report #: 7, DFS: 4.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 416
|APt)UWI 'Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD Slate AFE Number Total AFE Amounl
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 TSS-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Dale Rig Release Date RB-Ground Disiance (ft) ÕroundElevaÏiori(ÏÏK5) DaÏÏyCost CumCost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 85,317 247,163
Operations at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
Logging:re-run Baker-Atlas HDIL tool. Finish logging, Run & cernent 5 1/2"casing, rig down. 3,243 11,450
Operations Summary Deplh Start (ftKB) Depth End (flKB)
Drilled 7 7/8" hole f/ 5764' to 6180', sweep hole, L/D DP & tools, log well 5,764 6,180
Remarks Depth Slarl (TVD) (ftKB) Depth End (TVD) (ftKB)
Held PJSM w/ Crews. 5,761
Wealher Temperature (°F) Road Condilion Hole Condilion Target Formation Target Depth (flKB)
PC 38.0 Dusty |Good Wasatch 5,946
Last Casing Set Daily Contacts
Casing Description Set Depth (flKB) OD (in) Comment Job Contact | Mobile
Surface 365 Pre-set Kim D. Gritz j281-605-2103

Rigs
Time Lo9 Contractor Rig Number
Slart Time I End Time Dur (hrs) Operation Comment Frontier 5
06:00 13:30 7.50 Drilling Drill7 7/8" hole fl 5764' to 6180" w/ 440

gpm, 60 rpm, 16-23k wob. @ 35-155 fph. Mud Pumps
# 2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

13:30 14:30 1.00 Condition Mud &Circulate Pump Hi Vis Sweep B/Üx 2 Pump Rating {hp) Rod Diameter (in "Siioife rintFi(i
14:30 15:00 0.50 Trips Pull & stand back 5 stands to evaluate hole I 800.0 | 7.99

cond. ( slick ) Liner Size (in) VoFIStk0R (bblistki

15:00 16:00 1.00 LD Drillpipe Rig Up Franks Westates L/D Machine.
16:00 22:00 6.00 LD Drillpipe L/D Drillpipe , HWDP , DÓs, & Directional Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

tools. No

22:00 23:00 1.00 Wire Line Logs Rig up Baker-Atlas Loggers. # 1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Lengtn (in)23:00 06:00 7.00 Wire Line Logs Log well wlHDIL/SP/GR,Density/Neutron' 800.0 | 7.99Re-run HDIL as per Berry Petroleum LmerSi2e(in} Vol/StkOR(bbl/slk)

Geologist request.

Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
Mud Checks No
Typo Time Depth (flKB} [Density (Ib/gal) Vis (s/ql) PV Calc (cp) Yield Point (Ibf/100ft2)

iWater Base 06.00 6,180.0 | 8.45 27 1.000 Mud Additive Amounts
Gel (10s) (Ibif100.. Gel (10m) (Fbf/10 Gel (30m} (1bil10 . Fillrate (mLI30min) Filler Cake (132") pH Solids (%) Description | Consumed Daily Cost

Caustic Soda I 4.0 103.5211.0 0.1
MBT (Ib/bbl) Perconi Oil (%) Percent Waler {%) Chlorides (mg/L) |Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electric Slab (V) Dyna Fiber 5.0 98.05

99.9 10,900.000 680.000 2 Engineering 1.0 400.00
CEC for Cullings Wholo Mud Add bbl) Mud Losl lo Hole (bbi) Mud Losi (Surf) (bbl) Mud Vol (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Act) (bbl) Gypsum 23.0 313.95

i |
__ | | | KCL 42.0 756.00.

Air Data Lime 10.0 78.00
Salt Gel 35.0 315.00

Parasile ACFM (Italmin) IDalipipe ACFM (It=tmin) ECD Bil (Ibigal) ECD Parasile (Ib/gal) Sea Mud 10.0 126.80
Tax 1.0 95.94

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period Triinking 1.0 828.00
gis Injected down Parasite (gal) gis Injected in Mud (gal) Jgls Biocide Injected in Mud (gal)

Walnut Shell M 7.0 127.40
¯¯ Job Supplies

Drill Strings
BHA #1, Vertical Assy. Supply Item Descriplion Unit Label

Bit Run Dnli Bit lADC Bil Dull TFA (incl Noz) (In')

1 7 7/8in, FX55M, 11404114 3-1-CT-M-X-0-NO-TD 1.18 Total Received Total Consumed Total Returned

Nozzles (/32") String Length (fl) String Wt (1000lbf) BHA ROP (ft
16/16/16/16/16/16 6,143.47 135 59.9 Diesel Fuel Consumption

Drill String Components 03te I consumed

I max
Lobe Bit-Bend ft mingpm gpm

Jls
,

Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Slages rpm/gpm (fl) (gpm) (gpm) SN
l iMud Motor i 6 1/2 29.18
1.Pony NMDC 6 1/2 9.80
1,NMDC 6 1/2 28.41
1 Gap sub 6 1/2 5.63
6 DrillCollar 6 1/2 182.8

30 HWDP 4 1/2 921.85
1 X/O 4 1/2 0.94

157 DrillPipe 4 4,964.40
Drilling Parameters
Wollbore ISiart (ItKB) |Depth End (flKB)lÕumDepih (ft) :Drill Time (hrs) ICum Dnil Time ...lnt ROP (ft/hr) Flow Rale (gpm)
Original 5.764.0 6,180.0 5,815.00 7.50 97.00 55.5 440
Hole

,
WOB {1000161) RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) Roi HL 10001ttf) PU HL (1000FbDSO HL (10001bf) Drilling Torque Off Btm Tq

22 60 1,750.0 113 116 108 7,500.0 6,000.0
0 (g ir ¡) (il i Molor RPM (rpm T (In)) F) P BH A(LA) . T (bh) (°F) P(Surf Ann) T (surf arin) .. Q (liq rtrn) (g... Q (greturn) .

85 440.00
¯¯

ÀECEIVED April 26, 2010



April 26, 2010

g ) Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/21/2010
: Report #: 7, DFS: 4.8

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 416
Deviation Surveys
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April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/22/2010
Report #: 8, DFS: 5.6

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 0
APl/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD State AFE Number fotal AFE Amount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 T5S-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Rig Release Date KB-Ground Distance (ft) Ground Elevalion (ftKB) Daily Cost

¯
Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 67,783 314,946
Operalions at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
Rig down Mob. to SFW Fee 15-10-54 & Drill. 11,450
Operations Summary Depth Start (ftKB) Deplh End (fÏKB)
Logged well, R/U Ran 139 jts. 5 1/2" Prod. casing, cemented same, set slips, cleaned mud tanks, RR. 6,180 6,180

IRemarks Depth Start (l3/D) (flKB) Deplh End (IVD) (ftKB)
.Held PJSM w/ Crews.
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condibon Hole Condition ÏargetFormation Targel Depth (ftKB)
Overcast | 36.0 Dusty |Good Wasatch 5,946i

.Last Casing Set Daily Contacts
Casing Description ISel Depth (ftKB) OD (in) Comment Job Contact i Mobile
Production 6.160 5 1/2 Set slips w/ 80,000 Kim D. Gritz [281-605-2103

Rigs
Time Log. Contractor Rig Number
Start Time i End Time | Dur (hrs) i Operation Comment - Frontier 5
06:00 10:30 4.50 Wire Line Logs Re-run HDIL logging tool. R/D loggers.

Mud Pumps10:30 11:00 0.50 Run Casing & Cement Rig up Franks Westates Casers
# 2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

11:00 17:00 I 6.00 Run Casing & Cement Run in wl 138 Jts. 5 1/2" 15.50 J-55 Shoe Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Lenglh (in)

@6160' ,FC@ 6112', Marker @4101' 800.0 7.99
Held saftey MT.with rig crew / Franks csg Liner Size (in) Vol/Sik OR (bbl/stk)
service

17:00 18:00 1.00 Condition Mud & Circulate Circulate casing while rigging down casers Pressure (psi) siowspa Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
& R/U ProPetro Cementers No

18:00 20:00 2.00 Run Casing & Cement Pumped 210 sx. HifillLead cement w/ #1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Prem. Type V, 16% gel, 10#lsx Gilsonite, Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Lenglh (in)

33/sx GR3, 3% Salt, 1/4#lsx Flocel. Weight 800.0 7.99
11 ppg Yield 3.82 Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/sik)

Tail cement : 485sx 50/50 poz , prem class
i G cmt w 2%Gel 10%Salt 4 % CDI 33, .4%

Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
CFL 175, 1/4#lsx Flocel, Weight 14.2 Yield No
1.26 Mud Additive Amounts

i Final circulating press. 1600 psi. Bumped Descaption Consumed D y
plug w/ 500 psi. @19:24 Floats held..
Had 30 bbls. cement returns to surface Job Supplies
Marker joint @4101, Float collar@6112"
Shoe @ 6160'. supplyitem Descriplion ÏÏ[ibel

Total Received Total Consumed Tolal Relurned
20:00 20:30 0.50 Run Casing & Cement Rig down cementers.
20:30 22:30 2.00 NU/ND BOP Nipple down BOPs &Set slips w/ 80,000 Diesel Fuel Consumption
22:30 00:00 1.50 Rig Up &Tear Down Clean mud tanks & rig down.Release rig @ Date | Consumed

00:00 April 22, 2010

.NIud Checks
Type Time Depth (ItKB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis (siqi) PV Calc (cp) Yield Poini (Ibfl10011)

Gei (10s) (Ibf/100 Gel (10m) ObF/10. iGel (30m) (Ibfl10 Filtrate (mU30min) Filter Cake (132") pH Solids (%)

MBT (Ib/bbl) Percent Oil (% Percent Walor (%) hiondes (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electric Stab (V)

CEC for Cuttings Whole Mud Add (bbl Mud Lost to Hole (bbi Mud Lost (Surf} (bbl) Mud Voi (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Aci) (btO

Air Data

Parasite ACFM (ftalmin) Drillpipe ACFM (ft2/min) ECD Bit (Ib/gal) ECD ParasÏti(Ib/gaÏ)

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period
gls Injected down Parasite (gal) gis Injected in Mud (gal) gis Biocide injected in Mud (gal)

Drill Strings

Bil Run Drill Bit IADC Bit Dull Tf A (incl Noz) (in2

Nozzles (/32") Siring Length it) |Siring WI (1000Ibf) BHA ROP (ft
I

Drill String Components
max

Lobe Bit-Bend ft mingpm gpm
Jis Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN

RECEIVED April 26,

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/22/2010
Report #: 8, DFS: 5.6

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 0
APl/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD State AFE Number fotal AFE Amount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 T5S-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Rig Release Date KB-Ground Distance (ft) Ground Elevalion (ftKB) Daily Cost

¯
Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 67,783 314,946
Operalions at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
Rig down Mob. to SFW Fee 15-10-54 & Drill. 11,450
Operations Summary Depth Start (ftKB) Deplh End (fÏKB)
Logged well, R/U Ran 139 jts. 5 1/2" Prod. casing, cemented same, set slips, cleaned mud tanks, RR. 6,180 6,180

IRemarks Depth Start (l3/D) (flKB) Deplh End (IVD) (ftKB)
.Held PJSM w/ Crews.
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condibon Hole Condition ÏargetFormation Targel Depth (ftKB)
Overcast | 36.0 Dusty |Good Wasatch 5,946i

.Last Casing Set Daily Contacts
Casing Description ISel Depth (ftKB) OD (in) Comment Job Contact i Mobile
Production 6.160 5 1/2 Set slips w/ 80,000 Kim D. Gritz [281-605-2103

Rigs
Time Log. Contractor Rig Number
Start Time i End Time | Dur (hrs) i Operation Comment - Frontier 5
06:00 10:30 4.50 Wire Line Logs Re-run HDIL logging tool. R/D loggers.

Mud Pumps10:30 11:00 0.50 Run Casing & Cement Rig up Franks Westates Casers
# 2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

11:00 17:00 I 6.00 Run Casing & Cement Run in wl 138 Jts. 5 1/2" 15.50 J-55 Shoe Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Lenglh (in)

@6160' ,FC@ 6112', Marker @4101' 800.0 7.99
Held saftey MT.with rig crew / Franks csg Liner Size (in) Vol/Sik OR (bbl/stk)
service

17:00 18:00 1.00 Condition Mud & Circulate Circulate casing while rigging down casers Pressure (psi) siowspa Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
& R/U ProPetro Cementers No

18:00 20:00 2.00 Run Casing & Cement Pumped 210 sx. HifillLead cement w/ #1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Prem. Type V, 16% gel, 10#lsx Gilsonite, Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Lenglh (in)

33/sx GR3, 3% Salt, 1/4#lsx Flocel. Weight 800.0 7.99
11 ppg Yield 3.82 Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/sik)

Tail cement : 485sx 50/50 poz , prem class
i G cmt w 2%Gel 10%Salt 4 % CDI 33, .4%

Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
CFL 175, 1/4#lsx Flocel, Weight 14.2 Yield No
1.26 Mud Additive Amounts

i Final circulating press. 1600 psi. Bumped Descaption Consumed D y
plug w/ 500 psi. @19:24 Floats held..
Had 30 bbls. cement returns to surface Job Supplies
Marker joint @4101, Float collar@6112"
Shoe @ 6160'. supplyitem Descriplion ÏÏ[ibel

Total Received Total Consumed Tolal Relurned
20:00 20:30 0.50 Run Casing & Cement Rig down cementers.
20:30 22:30 2.00 NU/ND BOP Nipple down BOPs &Set slips w/ 80,000 Diesel Fuel Consumption
22:30 00:00 1.50 Rig Up &Tear Down Clean mud tanks & rig down.Release rig @ Date | Consumed

00:00 April 22, 2010
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RECEIVED April 26,

Berry Daily Drilling Repod Report Date: 4/22/2010
Report #: 8, DFS: 5.6

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 0
APl/UWI Surface Legal Location Spud Date Notice APD State AFE Number fotal AFE Amount
43-013-50245 SESE Sec. 10 T5S-R4W 3/19/10 Utah C10 032018 354,885
Spud Date Rig Release Date KB-Ground Distance (ft) Ground Elevalion (ftKB) Daily Cost

¯
Cum Cost To Date

4/16/2010 10:00:00 AM 4/22/2010 14.00 6,067 67,783 314,946
Operalions at Report Time Operations Next 24 Hours Daily Mud Cost Mud Additive Cost To Date
Rig down Mob. to SFW Fee 15-10-54 & Drill. 11,450
Operations Summary Depth Start (ftKB) Deplh End (fÏKB)
Logged well, R/U Ran 139 jts. 5 1/2" Prod. casing, cemented same, set slips, cleaned mud tanks, RR. 6,180 6,180

IRemarks Depth Start (l3/D) (flKB) Deplh End (IVD) (ftKB)
.Held PJSM w/ Crews.
Weather Temperature (°F) Road Condibon Hole Condition ÏargetFormation Targel Depth (ftKB)
Overcast | 36.0 Dusty |Good Wasatch 5,946i

.Last Casing Set Daily Contacts
Casing Description ISel Depth (ftKB) OD (in) Comment Job Contact i Mobile
Production 6.160 5 1/2 Set slips w/ 80,000 Kim D. Gritz [281-605-2103

Rigs
Time Log. Contractor Rig Number
Start Time i End Time | Dur (hrs) i Operation Comment - Frontier 5
06:00 10:30 4.50 Wire Line Logs Re-run HDIL logging tool. R/D loggers.

Mud Pumps10:30 11:00 0.50 Run Casing & Cement Rig up Franks Westates Casers
# 2, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8

11:00 17:00 I 6.00 Run Casing & Cement Run in wl 138 Jts. 5 1/2" 15.50 J-55 Shoe Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Lenglh (in)

@6160' ,FC@ 6112', Marker @4101' 800.0 7.99
Held saftey MT.with rig crew / Franks csg Liner Size (in) Vol/Sik OR (bbl/stk)
service

17:00 18:00 1.00 Condition Mud & Circulate Circulate casing while rigging down casers Pressure (psi) siowspa Strokes (spm) Eff (%)
& R/U ProPetro Cementers No

18:00 20:00 2.00 Run Casing & Cement Pumped 210 sx. HifillLead cement w/ #1, Gardner-Denver, PZ-8
Prem. Type V, 16% gel, 10#lsx Gilsonite, Pump Rating (hp) Rod Diameter (in) Stroke Lenglh (in)

33/sx GR3, 3% Salt, 1/4#lsx Flocel. Weight 800.0 7.99
11 ppg Yield 3.82 Liner Size (in) Vol/Stk OR (bbl/sik)

Tail cement : 485sx 50/50 poz , prem class
i G cmt w 2%Gel 10%Salt 4 % CDI 33, .4%

Pressure (psi) Slow Spd Strokes (spm) Eff (%)

CFL 175, 1/4#lsx Flocel, Weight 14.2 Yield No
1.26 Mud Additive Amounts

i Final circulating press. 1600 psi. Bumped Descaption Consumed D y
plug w/ 500 psi. @19:24 Floats held..
Had 30 bbls. cement returns to surface Job Supplies
Marker joint @4101, Float collar@6112"
Shoe @ 6160'. supplyitem Descriplion ÏÏ[ibel

Total Received Total Consumed Tolal Relurned
20:00 20:30 0.50 Run Casing & Cement Rig down cementers.
20:30 22:30 2.00 NU/ND BOP Nipple down BOPs &Set slips w/ 80,000 Diesel Fuel Consumption
22:30 00:00 1.50 Rig Up &Tear Down Clean mud tanks & rig down.Release rig @ Date | Consumed

00:00 April 22, 2010

.NIud Checks
Type Time Depth (ItKB) Density (Ib/gal) Vis (siqi) PV Calc (cp) Yield Poini (Ibfl10011)

Gei (10s) (Ibf/100 Gel (10m) ObF/10. iGel (30m) (Ibfl10 Filtrate (mU30min) Filter Cake (132") pH Solids (%)

MBT (Ib/bbl) Percent Oil (% Percent Walor (%) hiondes (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) KCL (%) Electric Stab (V)

CEC for Cuttings Whole Mud Add (bbl Mud Lost to Hole (bbi Mud Lost (Surf} (bbl) Mud Voi (Res) (bbl) Mud Vol (Aci) (btO

Air Data

Parasite ACFM (ftalmin) Drillpipe ACFM (ft2/min) ECD Bit (Ib/gal) ECD ParasÏti(Ib/gaÏ)

Corrosion Inhibitor Injected in 24hr Period
gls Injected down Parasite (gal) gis Injected in Mud (gal) gis Biocide injected in Mud (gal)

Drill Strings

Bil Run Drill Bit IADC Bit Dull Tf A (incl Noz) (in2

Nozzles (/32") Siring Length it) |Siring WI (1000Ibf) BHA ROP (ft
I

Drill String Components
max

Lobe Bit-Bend ft mingpm gpm
Jis Item Description OD (in) Len (ft) config Stages rpm/gpm (ft) (gpm) (gpm) SN

RECEIVED April 26,



April 26, 2010

Berry Daily Drilling Report Report Date: 4/22/2010
Report #: 8, DFS: 5.6

f& Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 Depth Progress: 0
DrillIng Parameters
Wollttore Start (fiKB) Dopih End (flKS) Cum Depih ((t) DrillTime (hrs) ComDrili Time . Int ROP (It/hr) Flow Rale (gpm)

.WOS (1000Ibf) RPM (rpm) SPP (psi) ROIHL (1000Ibf} PU HL (100DIbf) SO HL (1000Ibf) Drilling Torque Off Sim Tq

Q (g ing) (fft Motor RPM (rpm) T (ID )('F) P (BH Ann) (.. T (ch) (°F) (Surf Ann) T (surfann) Q (lig rirn) ( Q (g return)

Deviatlon Surveys
Vertical hole
Azim Dale Description EWho in llaclin.. MD Tie In (ft . NSTie in NDTie 16(fl.
0.00 | 4/16/2010 Vertical hele 0.00 | 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Survey Data
MD (flKB) Inci (*} Ãz ) | TVD (IIKB) NS (fi) | EW (fi) VS (It) | 01.8 (910011)

Il Ilil

I
I
I

I

I

I
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Il Ilil

I
I
I

I

I
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Vertical hole
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RECEIVED April 26,



API Well No: 43013502450000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-5517 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 Ute 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 State Tribal 16-10-54 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BRUNDAGE CANYON 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0474 FSL 0658 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

5/17/2010

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 WENT TO SALES ON MAY
17, 2010.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Kathy K. Fieldsted

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5/18/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 999-4044  Ext 

1ST SALES

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 722-1325

May 18, 2010

May 18, 2010

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Bo× 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/17/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: 1ST SALES

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 WENT TO SALES ON MAY
17, 2010. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâgggNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/18/2010

RECEIVED May 18,

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Bo× 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/17/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: 1ST SALES

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 WENT TO SALES ON MAY
17, 2010. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâgggNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/18/2010

RECEIVED May 18,

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Bo× 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/17/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: 1ST SALES

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE NOTE THAT THE STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 WENT TO SALES ON MAY
17, 2010. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâgggNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/18/2010

RECEIVED May 18,



API Well No: 43013502450000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-5517 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 Ute 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 State Tribal 16-10-54 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Box 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BRUNDAGE CANYON 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0474 FSL 0658 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.0S Range: 04.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5/6/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 PLEASE SEE THE ATTACHED COMPLETION PROCEDURE FOR THE STATE
TRIBAL 16-10-54.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Kathy K. Fieldsted

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6/4/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 999-4044  Ext 

Completion Procedure

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 722-1325

June 04, 2010

June 07, 2010

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Bo× 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/6/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Completion Procedure

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE SEE THE ATTACHED COMPLETION PROCEDURE FOR THE STATE
TRIBAL 16-10-54. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Jun 07,, 20

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/4/2010

RECEIVED June 04,

iPI Well No: 43013502450000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 4
E DESI55N1A7TION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS teF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well State Tribal 16-10-54

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY 43013502450000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
4000 South 4028 West Rt 2 Bo× 7735 , Roosevelt, UT, 84066 303 999-4044 Ext BRUNDAGE CANYON

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

0474 FSL 0658 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SESE Section: 10 Township: 05.05 Range: 04.0W Meridian: U UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/6/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Completion Procedure

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PLEASE SEE THE ATTACHED COMPLETION PROCEDURE FOR THE STATE
TRIBAL 16-10-54. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Jun 07,, 20

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kathy K. Fieldsted 435 722-1325 Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech.

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/4/2010

RECEIVED June 04,

iPI Well No: 43013502450000
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June 04, 2010

State Tribal 16-10-54 May 10, 2010
LWR GREEN RIVER COMPLETION

SHL: 474' FSL & 658' FEL (SESE)
BHL: 474' FSL & 658' FEL (SESE)

Sec. 10, T5S-R4W
Duchesne County, Utah

API No: 43-013-50245
Depth: TD 6180'
Elevation: GL 606T; KB 6079'; KB 12' above GL
CSG: 8 5/8" 32.00# J-55 LTC set @ 365' KB cemented wl 250

sx Class G
5 ½" 15.5# J-55 LTC @6160' KB cemented wl 210 sx PL
lead & 485 sx PLHS tail
Mkr jt @4102' Length 10.66'
FC @6113'

TBG: 2 7/8" 6.5# J-55 8rd wl 2 7/8" SN 1 jt off btm. EOT @
xxxx', TAC @xxxx.

FM: Douglas Creek 4,366'; Black Shale 4,998'; Castle Peak
Ls 5,300'; Uteland Butte Ls 5,730'; Wasatch 5,946'.

Required TOC: Surface (GL)

Correlate Depths to that certain Baker Hughes HD Induction Log and
Compensated Densityl Compensated Neutron Log dated 20-Apr-2010.
**Akkkttkkkkt*kkAkkthkkkkkkhkkkkkkkkWA**************************************************************

PROGRAM:

1) Install surface production equipment and pumping unit.

2) NU frachead & BOPE. Load hole.

3) MIRUwireline w/ mast pole. Run GR/CCL/CBL from PBTD to surface. Verify
PBTD & acceptable cmt bond across zones to be completed. Make sure that
CBL is run to a shallow enough depth so that the TOC can be identified.
Test csg to 2,000 psi. Contact Denver if CBL or pressure test unsatisfactory. If
acceptable, proceed and perf the following Uteland Butte interval @ 120° w/ 19
gm charges, 0.36" diameter holes:

No.
Interval: 1 Top Perf Btm Perf SPF Length Perfs

5735 5736 2 1 2
5737 5738 2 1 2
5761 5762 2 1 2
5783 5784 2 1 2
5795 5796 2 1 2
5797 5798 2 1 2
5804 5805 2 1 2
5806 5807 2 1 2
5816 5817 2 1 2
5839 5840 2 1 2
5857 5858 2 1 2
5899 5900 2 1 2
5927 5928 2 1 2
5935 5936 2 1 2

Total: 14 28

4) RU frac equip. & frac down csg per design f/ Interval 1. SD & record ISIP. RD
frac equip. RU wireline. RIH w/ 5 ½" solid composite plug; run in tandem w/ 3
1/8" csg gun(s). Set plug @ +/- xxxx. Perf the following Castle Peak interval @
120° w/ 19 gm charges, 0.36" diameter holes:

RECEIVED June 04,
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June 04, 2010

No.
Interval: 2 Top Perf Btm Perf SPF Length Perfs

5494 5495 2 1 2
5524 5525 2 1 2
5542 5545 2 3 6
5547 5548 2 1 2
5578 5579 2 1 2
5580 5581 2 1 2
5627 5628 2 1 2
5641 5642 2 1 2
5659 5660 2 1 2
5669 5670 2 1 2
5680 5681 2 1 2
5703 5704 2 1 2

Total: 14 28

5) RU frac equip. & frac down csg per design fl Interval 2. SD & record ISIP. RD
frac equip. RU wireline. RIH w/ 5 ½" solid composite plug; run in tandem w/ 3
1/8" csg gun(s). Set plug @ +/- xxxx. Perf the following Castle Peak interval @120° w/ 19 gm charges, 0.36" diameter holes:

No.
Interval: 3 Top Perf Btm Perf SPF Length Perfs

5336 5339 2 3 6
5344 5347 2 3 6
5349 5350 2 1 2
5351 5352 2 1 2
5388 5389 2 1 2
5390 5391 2 1 2
5404 5407 2 3 6

Total: 13 26

6) RU frac equip. & frac down csg per design fl Interval 3. SD & record ISIP. RD
frac equip. RU wireline. RIH w/ 5 ½" solid composite plug; run in tandem w/ 3
1/8" csg gun(s). Set plug @ +/- xxxx. Perf the following BIk. Sh. interval @ 120°
w/ 19 gm charges, 0.36" diameter holes:

No.
Interval: 4 Top Perf Btm Ped SPF Length Perfs

5052 5056 2 4 8
5113 5116 2 3 6
5120 5125 2 5 10
5127 5132 2 5 10
5136 5137 2 1 2
5138 5139 2 1 2

Total: 19 38

7) RU frac equip. & frac down csg per design fl Interval 4. SD & record ISIP. RD
frac equip. RU wireline. RIH w/ 5 ½" solid composite plug; run in tandem w/ 3
1/8" csg gun(s). Set plug @ +/- xxxx. Perf the following Douglas Creek intental
@ 120° w/ 19 gm charges, 0.36" diameter holes:

RECEIVED June 04,
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June 04, 2010

No.
Interval: 5 Top Perf Btm Perf SPF Length Perfs

4685 4686 2 1 2
4687 4688 2 1 2
4775 4776 2 1 2
4776 4777 2 1 2
4791 4792 2 1 2
4793 4794 2 1 2
4802 4805 2 3 6
4844 4845 2 1 2
4846 4847 2 1 2
4941 4944 2 3 6
4946 4947 2 1 2
4949 4950 2 1 2

Total: 16 32

8) RU frac equip. & frac down csg per design fl Interval 5. SD & record ISIP. RD
frac equip. RU wireline. RIH w/ 5 ½" solid composite plug; run in tandem w/ 3
1/8" csg gun(s). Set plug @ +/- xxxx Perf the following Douglas Creek interval
@ 120° w/ 19 gm charges, 0.36" diameter holes:

No.
Interval: 6 Top Ped Btm Perf SPF Length Perfs

4400 4404 2 4 8
4408 4409 2 1 2
4410 4411 2 1 2
4447 4448 2 1 2
4449 4450 2 1 2
4451 4452 2 1 2
4453 4454 2 1 2
4556 4560 2 4 8
4561 4562 2 1 2
4567 4570 2 3 6
4571 4572 2 1 2
4573 4574 2 1 2

Total: 20 40

9) RU frac equip. &frac down csg per design f/ Interval 6. SD and record ISIP. RD
frac equipment from wellhead. Open and flow well to tank.

10) RIH w/ 2 ½" tbg w/ bit. RIH wl tbg to top of plug. Clean-out to PBTD. Circulate
hole clean. POOH & lay down bit.

11) PU NC & SN & 5 ½" anchor catcher. Pull up & set anchor catcher & SN below
bottom perfs. ND BOPE. NU tbg head & flow tee. RIH w/ pump & rod string.
Seat pump & space out. Fill tbg & press test to 500 psi. Hang on clamps. Start
well pumping. RDMO.
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June 04, 2010

ST 16-10-54

Stage
1: Uteland Butte Top Perf: 5735 ft

Btm Perf: 5936 ft

16/30
Total Proppant: 60,000 Lb White

Rate: 40 Bpm

Voi Vol Prop
Stage (Gal) (bbis) Beg. PPA End PPA (Ib)

1 Pad 500 11.9
2 Acid 250 6.0
3 Pad 11000 261.9
4 1-3 PPA Ramp 19500 464.3 1 3 39000
5 3-4 PPA Ramp 6000 142.9 3 4 21000
6 Spacer 31 0.7
7 Acid 250 6.0
8 Flush 5452 129.8

Total Fluid: 1023 Bbls

Stage
2: Castle Peak Top Perf: 5494 ft

Btm Perf: 5704 ft

16/30
Total Proppant: 57,000 lb White

Rate: 40 Bpm

Vol Vol Prop
Stage (Gal) (bbis) Beg. PPA End PPA (Ib)

1 Pad 7200 171.4
2 1-5 PPA Ramp 9500 226.2 1 5 28500
3 5 PPA Hold 5700 135.7 5 5 28500
4 Spacer 87 2.1
5 Acid 250 6.0
6 Flush 5153 122.7

Total Fluid: 664 Bbis

Stage
3: Castle Peak Top Perf: 5336 ft

Btm Perf: 5407 ft

16/30
Total Proppant: 45,000 lb White

Rate: 40 bpm

Vol Vol Prop
Stage (Gal) (bbis) Beg. PPA End PPA (Ib)

1 Pad 5700 135.7
2 1-5 PPA Ramp 7500 178.6 1 5 22500
3 5 PPA Hold 4500 107.1 5 5 22500
4 Spacer 197 4.7
5 Acid 250 6.0
6 Flush 4889 116.4

Total Fluid: 548 Bbls
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Total Proppant: 60,000 Lb White

Rate: 40 Bpm

Voi Vol Prop
Stage (Gal) (bbis) Beg. PPA End PPA (Ib)

1 Pad 500 11.9
2 Acid 250 6.0
3 Pad 11000 261.9
4 1-3 PPA Ramp 19500 464.3 1 3 39000
5 3-4 PPA Ramp 6000 142.9 3 4 21000
6 Spacer 31 0.7
7 Acid 250 6.0
8 Flush 5452 129.8

Total Fluid: 1023 Bbls

Stage
2: Castle Peak Top Perf: 5494 ft

Btm Perf: 5704 ft

16/30
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Rate: 40 Bpm

Vol Vol Prop
Stage (Gal) (bbis) Beg. PPA End PPA (Ib)

1 Pad 7200 171.4
2 1-5 PPA Ramp 9500 226.2 1 5 28500
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Stage
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16/30
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6 Flush 4889 116.4

Total Fluid: 548 Bbls

RECEIVED June 04,



June 04, 2010

Stage
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Btm Perf: 5138 ft

16/30
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Rate: 40 Bpm
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Btm Perf: 4949 ft

16/30
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6 Flush 4321 102.9

Total Fluid: 504 Bbls

Stage
6: Douglas Creek Top Perf: 4400 ft

Btm Perf: 4573 ft

16/30
Total Proppant: 55,000 Lb White

Rate: 40 Bpm
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4 Flush 4400 104.8

Total Fluid: 618 Bbls

Tanks
Needed: 9
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STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT FORM 8

O DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes)
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

14-20-H62-5517
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG UTE
ia. TYPE OF WELL: O

LL
GW

LL DRY OTHER 7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

RL
ORZ EP-

EN RY
EFSFŸR.

OTHER STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

BERRY PETROLEUM 4301350245
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

ROUTE 2 BOX 7735 orrv ROOSEVELT swa UT w 84066 (435) 722-1325 BRUNDAGE
4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
ATSURFACE: 474 FSL, 658 FEL SESE 10 5S 4W U
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW: SAME AS ABOVE

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
ATTOTALDEPTH: SAME AS ABOVE DUCHESNE UTAH

14. DATESPUDDED: 15. DATEf.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

3/20/2010 4/22/2010 5/14/2010 ABANDONED READYTOPRODUCE 2 6067 GL
18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 80 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 6,112 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD

PLUG SET:
TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC ANDOTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy ofeach) 23.

WAS WELL CORED? NO ¥ES (Submit analysis)ELECTRONIC
WAS DST RUNT NO YES (Submit repo

DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINERRECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT (#/ft) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGED MHENTER CNEMENTTYPKES VOLSWMRE
BL) CEMENTTOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

13.5 8.625 J-55 32.0 0 365 G 250 0
7.875 5.5 J-55 15.5 6,160 PL 210 0

PLHS 485

25. TUBING RECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SlZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD)

2.875 6,018
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM(TVD) INTERVAL(Top/Bot - MD) SlZE NO. HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) UTELAND 5,735 5,936 5,735 5,936 .36 14 open squeezed

(B) CASTLE PEAK 5,336 5,704 5,336 5,704 .36 27 open Squeezed

(c) BLACKSHALE 5,052 5,139 5,052 5,139 .36 19 OPen 2] squeezed
¯¯

(D) DOUGLASCREE 4,400 4,950 4,400 4,950 .36 36 open 2 squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

UTELAND BUTTE 60,000 LBS SAND & 1023 BBLS FLUID
CASTLE PEAK 102,000 LBS SAND & 1212 BBLS FLUID
BLACKSHALE 45,000 LBS, SAND &542 BBLS FLUID

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICALIMECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY

SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)
RECEIVED
JUN22 2010

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&
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31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

5/17/2010 6/11/2010 24 RATES: 146 268 50 PUMP
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG, PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GASIOILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

400 110 RATES: -+ PRODUCIN(
INTERVALB (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAV1TY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -•

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: BG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALD (As shown In item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

SOLD
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show allimportant zones of porosity and contents thereof:Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushionused, time toolopen,flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation Bo m Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu ed Depth)

GR (NEW) 1,851
MAHOGANY 2,532
TGR3 3.593
DOUGLASCREEK 4,358
BLACKSHALE 5.011
CASTLE PEAK 5,300
UTELAND 5,731
WASATCH 5,948

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (Include plugg ng procedure)

FRAC: DOUGLASCREEK 97,000 LBS SAND & 1122 BBLS FLUID

36. I hereby certifythat the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRI T} -'ATHYK. FIELD TED
,

TITLE SR. REGULATORY& PERMITTlNGTECH

SIGNATURE DATE 6/18/2010

This report must be suomitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

**\TEM24: CementTop-Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil,Gas and ivlining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
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RATES: ->

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

SOLD
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show allimportant zones of porosity and contents thereof:Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushionused, time toolopen,flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation Bo m Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu ed Depth)

GR (NEW) 1,851
MAHOGANY 2,532
TGR3 3.593
DOUGLASCREEK 4,358
BLACKSHALE 5.011
CASTLE PEAK 5,300
UTELAND 5,731
WASATCH 5,948

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (Include plugg ng procedure)

FRAC: DOUGLASCREEK 97,000 LBS SAND & 1122 BBLS FLUID

36. I hereby certifythat the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRI T} -'ATHYK. FIELD TED
,

TITLE SR. REGULATORY& PERMITTlNGTECH

SIGNATURE DATE 6/18/2010

This report must be suomitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

**\TEM24: CementTop-Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperaturesurvey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil,Gas and ivlining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

See attached list

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantly deepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPL1CAT10NFOR PEgM1T TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL Q GAS WELL OTHER See Attached List
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
Berry Petroleum Attached

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
Rt 2 Box 7735 CITY Roosevelt STATE UT ziP 84066 (435) 722-1325

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY: Duchesrie

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT S1DETRACKTO REPA1RWELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAlR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUB1NGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATlONS RECLAMATlON OF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Produced wastewater from Berry Petroleum Company wells (see attached well list) willbe or have been used for injection in
our enhanced oil recovery project(s) in the Brundage Canyon Field or they willbe truckedto one of the following approved
waste water disposal sites: COPYSENTTOOPERATOR
• R.N. Industries, Inc. Sec. 4, T2S, R2W, Bluebell Date:
• MC & MC Disposal Sec. 12, T6S, R19E, Vernal
• LaPoint Recycle & Storage Sec. 12, T5S, R19E, LaPoint initiais:
• Water Disposal Inc. Sec. 32, T1S, R1W, Roosevelt
• ITL4461 W 3000 So Roosevelt Location Pleasant Valley
• IWM PO Box 430 Altamont or 20250 W 2000 S Duchesne Location - Blue Bench
• Pro Water 12223 Highland Ave Ste B503 Rancho Cucamonga Ca 91739 Location - Blue Bench

Approvedby the
UtahDivisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining

Date:

NAMF (PI FASF PRINT) Krista Mecham By Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech

SIGNATURE DATE 11/21/2012

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

See attached list

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantly deepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPL1CAT10NFOR PEgM1T TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL Q GAS WELL OTHER See Attached List
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
Berry Petroleum Attached

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
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4. LOCATIONOF WELL
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11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
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ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT S1DETRACKTO REPA1RWELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAlR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUB1NGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATlONS RECLAMATlON OF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Produced wastewater from Berry Petroleum Company wells (see attached well list) willbe or have been used for injection in
our enhanced oil recovery project(s) in the Brundage Canyon Field or they willbe truckedto one of the following approved
waste water disposal sites: COPYSENTTOOPERATOR
• R.N. Industries, Inc. Sec. 4, T2S, R2W, Bluebell Date:
• MC & MC Disposal Sec. 12, T6S, R19E, Vernal
• LaPoint Recycle & Storage Sec. 12, T5S, R19E, LaPoint initiais:
• Water Disposal Inc. Sec. 32, T1S, R1W, Roosevelt
• ITL4461 W 3000 So Roosevelt Location Pleasant Valley
• IWM PO Box 430 Altamont or 20250 W 2000 S Duchesne Location - Blue Bench
• Pro Water 12223 Highland Ave Ste B503 Rancho Cucamonga Ca 91739 Location - Blue Bench

Approvedby the
UtahDivisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining

Date:

NAMF (PI FASF PRINT) Krista Mecham By Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech

SIGNATURE DATE 11/21/2012

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
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Berry Petroleum Attached
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Rt 2 Box 7735 CITY Roosevelt STATE UT ziP 84066 (435) 722-1325

4. LOCATIONOF WELL
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QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
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CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATlONS RECLAMATlON OF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Produced wastewater from Berry Petroleum Company wells (see attached well list) willbe or have been used for injection in
our enhanced oil recovery project(s) in the Brundage Canyon Field or they willbe truckedto one of the following approved
waste water disposal sites: COPYSENTTOOPERATOR
• R.N. Industries, Inc. Sec. 4, T2S, R2W, Bluebell Date:
• MC & MC Disposal Sec. 12, T6S, R19E, Vernal
• LaPoint Recycle & Storage Sec. 12, T5S, R19E, LaPoint initiais:
• Water Disposal Inc. Sec. 32, T1S, R1W, Roosevelt
• ITL4461 W 3000 So Roosevelt Location Pleasant Valley
• IWM PO Box 430 Altamont or 20250 W 2000 S Duchesne Location - Blue Bench
• Pro Water 12223 Highland Ave Ste B503 Rancho Cucamonga Ca 91739 Location - Blue Bench

Approvedby the
UtahDivisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining

Date:

NAMF (PI FASF PRINT) Krista Mecham By Sr. Regulatory & Permitting Tech

SIGNATURE DATE 11/21/2012

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



API Well Name Lease
43-013-32710 #1 DLB 12-15-56 Fee
43-013-33447 1-15-56 DLB Fee
43-013-33378 14-11-56 DLB Fee
43-013-30842 BC UTE TRIBAL 14-15 14-20-H62-3412
43-013-30841 BC UTE TRIBAL 16-16 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-30829 BC UTE TRIBAL 8-21 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-30755 BC UTE TRIBAL 4-22 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33216 BERRY TRIBAL 1-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33867 BERRY TRIBAL 2-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33384 BERRY TRIBAL 4-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33381 BERRY TRIBAL 7-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33383 BERRY TRIBAL 7-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33417 BERRY TRIBAL 8-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33465 BERRY TRIBAL 9-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33382 BERRY TRIBAL 9-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33724 BERRY TRIBAL 10-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33422 BERRY TRIBAL 10-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33725 BERRY TRIBAL ll-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33529 BERRY TRIBAL ll-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-50527 BERRY TRIBAL 12-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-34043 BERRY TRIBAL 13-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33989 BERRY TRIBAL 14-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33217 BERRY TRIBAL 15-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33411 BERRY TRIBAL 15-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33464 BERRY TRIBAL 16-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-50524 FEDERAL 1-1D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-51142 FEDERAL 1-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-51232 FEDERAL 1-11-65 UTU-77330
43-013-50326 FEDERAL 10-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33542 FEDERAL 10-2-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33386 FEDERAL 10-3-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50735 FEDERAL 10-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-33451 FEDERAL 11-10-65 UTU-77330
43-013-50327 FEDERAL ll-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50763 FEDERAL ll-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50565 FEDERAL 11-4D-64 UTU-77314
43-013-50348 FEDERAL ll-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-34284 FEDERAL 11-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50328 FEDERAL 12-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50737 FEDERAL 12-3D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50349 FEDERAL 12-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50261 FEDERAL 12-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50730 FEDERAL 1-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-33966 FEDERAL 1-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50329 FEDERAL 13-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50337 FEDERAL 13-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50347 FEDERAL 13-6D-64 UTU77322
43-013-50330 FEDERAL 14-1D-65

API Well Name Lease
43-013-32710 #1 DLB 12-15-56 Fee
43-013-33447 1-15-56 DLB Fee
43-013-33378 14-11-56 DLB Fee
43-013-30842 BC UTE TRIBAL 14-15 14-20-H62-3412
43-013-30841 BC UTE TRIBAL 16-16 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-30829 BC UTE TRIBAL 8-21 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-30755 BC UTE TRIBAL 4-22 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33216 BERRY TRIBAL 1-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33867 BERRY TRIBAL 2-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33384 BERRY TRIBAL 4-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33381 BERRY TRIBAL 7-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33383 BERRY TRIBAL 7-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33417 BERRY TRIBAL 8-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33465 BERRY TRIBAL 9-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33382 BERRY TRIBAL 9-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33724 BERRY TRIBAL 10-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33422 BERRY TRIBAL 10-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33725 BERRY TRIBAL ll-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33529 BERRY TRIBAL ll-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-50527 BERRY TRIBAL 12-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-34043 BERRY TRIBAL 13-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33989 BERRY TRIBAL 14-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33217 BERRY TRIBAL 15-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33411 BERRY TRIBAL 15-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33464 BERRY TRIBAL 16-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-50524 FEDERAL 1-1D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-51142 FEDERAL 1-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-51232 FEDERAL 1-11-65 UTU-77330
43-013-50326 FEDERAL 10-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33542 FEDERAL 10-2-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33386 FEDERAL 10-3-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50735 FEDERAL 10-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-33451 FEDERAL 11-10-65 UTU-77330
43-013-50327 FEDERAL ll-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50763 FEDERAL ll-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50565 FEDERAL 11-4D-64 UTU-77314
43-013-50348 FEDERAL ll-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-34284 FEDERAL 11-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50328 FEDERAL 12-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50737 FEDERAL 12-3D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50349 FEDERAL 12-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50261 FEDERAL 12-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50730 FEDERAL 1-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-33966 FEDERAL 1-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50329 FEDERAL 13-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50337 FEDERAL 13-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50347 FEDERAL 13-6D-64 UTU77322
43-013-50330 FEDERAL 14-1D-65

API Well Name Lease
43-013-32710 #1 DLB 12-15-56 Fee
43-013-33447 1-15-56 DLB Fee
43-013-33378 14-11-56 DLB Fee
43-013-30842 BC UTE TRIBAL 14-15 14-20-H62-3412
43-013-30841 BC UTE TRIBAL 16-16 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-30829 BC UTE TRIBAL 8-21 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-30755 BC UTE TRIBAL 4-22 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33216 BERRY TRIBAL 1-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33867 BERRY TRIBAL 2-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33384 BERRY TRIBAL 4-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33381 BERRY TRIBAL 7-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33383 BERRY TRIBAL 7-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33417 BERRY TRIBAL 8-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33465 BERRY TRIBAL 9-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33382 BERRY TRIBAL 9-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33724 BERRY TRIBAL 10-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33422 BERRY TRIBAL 10-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33725 BERRY TRIBAL ll-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33529 BERRY TRIBAL ll-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-50527 BERRY TRIBAL 12-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-34043 BERRY TRIBAL 13-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33989 BERRY TRIBAL 14-23D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33217 BERRY TRIBAL 15-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-33411 BERRY TRIBAL 15-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-33464 BERRY TRIBAL 16-34D-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-50524 FEDERAL 1-1D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-51142 FEDERAL 1-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-51232 FEDERAL 1-11-65 UTU-77330
43-013-50326 FEDERAL 10-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33542 FEDERAL 10-2-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33386 FEDERAL 10-3-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50735 FEDERAL 10-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-33451 FEDERAL 11-10-65 UTU-77330
43-013-50327 FEDERAL ll-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50763 FEDERAL ll-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50565 FEDERAL 11-4D-64 UTU-77314
43-013-50348 FEDERAL ll-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-34284 FEDERAL 11-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50328 FEDERAL 12-1D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50737 FEDERAL 12-3D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50349 FEDERAL 12-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50261 FEDERAL 12-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50730 FEDERAL 1-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-33966 FEDERAL 1-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50329 FEDERAL 13-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50337 FEDERAL 13-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50347 FEDERAL 13-6D-64 UTU77322
43-013-50330 FEDERAL 14-1D-65



43-013-50338 FEDERAL 14-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-34285 FEDERAL 14-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51175 FEDERAL 15-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50764 FEDERAL 15-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50553 FEDERAL 15-5D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-51176 FEDERAL 16-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33490 FEDERAL 16-5-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50266 FEDERAL 1-6-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51233 FEDERAL 2-11D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50759 FEDERAL 2-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33385 FEDERAL 2-2-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34018 FEDERAL 2-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-34286 FEDERAL 2-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51093 FEDERAL 3-12D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50760 FEDERAL 3-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34001 FEDERAL 3-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50782 FEDERAL 3-4D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-34287 FEDERAL 3-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50268 FEDERAL 3-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51094 FEDERAL 4-12D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50736 FEDERAL 4-3D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50521 FEDERAL 4-4D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50263 FEDERAL 4-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50267 FEDERAL 4-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51095 FEDERAL 5-12D-65 UTU-77330
43-013-50761 FEDERAL 5-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33448 FEDERAL 5-3-64 UTU-77321
43-013-33450 FEDERAL 5-4-64 UTU-77326
43-013-33387 FEDERAL 5-4-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50259 FEDERAL 5-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-33489 FEDERAL 5-6-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50269 FEDERAL 5-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-33491 FEDERAL 6-11-65 UTU-77330
43-013-51096 FEDERAL 6-12D-65 UTU-77330
43-013-32699 FEDERAL 6-1-65 UTU-77325
43-013-32557 FEDERAL 6-2-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50522 FEDERAL 6-3D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-34288 FEDERAL 6-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-33745 FEDERAL 6-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50566 FEDERAL 6-6D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-34061 FEDERAL 7-11D-65 UTU-77330
43-013-34015 FEDERAL 7-lD-65 UTU-77325
43-013-50734 FEDERAL 7-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50525 FEDERAL 7-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34065 FEDERAL 7-3D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34020 FEDERAL 7-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51232 FEDERAL 8-11D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33449 FEDERAL 8-1-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50350 FEDERAL 8-lD-65

43-013-50338 FEDERAL 14-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-34285 FEDERAL 14-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51175 FEDERAL 15-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50764 FEDERAL 15-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50553 FEDERAL 15-5D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-51176 FEDERAL 16-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33490 FEDERAL 16-5-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50266 FEDERAL 1-6-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51233 FEDERAL 2-11D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50759 FEDERAL 2-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33385 FEDERAL 2-2-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34018 FEDERAL 2-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-34286 FEDERAL 2-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51093 FEDERAL 3-12D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50760 FEDERAL 3-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34001 FEDERAL 3-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50782 FEDERAL 3-4D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-34287 FEDERAL 3-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50268 FEDERAL 3-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51094 FEDERAL 4-12D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50736 FEDERAL 4-3D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50521 FEDERAL 4-4D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50263 FEDERAL 4-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50267 FEDERAL 4-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51095 FEDERAL 5-12D-65 UTU-77330
43-013-50761 FEDERAL 5-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33448 FEDERAL 5-3-64 UTU-77321
43-013-33450 FEDERAL 5-4-64 UTU-77326
43-013-33387 FEDERAL 5-4-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50259 FEDERAL 5-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-33489 FEDERAL 5-6-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50269 FEDERAL 5-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-33491 FEDERAL 6-11-65 UTU-77330
43-013-51096 FEDERAL 6-12D-65 UTU-77330
43-013-32699 FEDERAL 6-1-65 UTU-77325
43-013-32557 FEDERAL 6-2-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50522 FEDERAL 6-3D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-34288 FEDERAL 6-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-33745 FEDERAL 6-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50566 FEDERAL 6-6D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-34061 FEDERAL 7-11D-65 UTU-77330
43-013-34015 FEDERAL 7-lD-65 UTU-77325
43-013-50734 FEDERAL 7-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50525 FEDERAL 7-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34065 FEDERAL 7-3D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34020 FEDERAL 7-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51232 FEDERAL 8-11D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33449 FEDERAL 8-1-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50350 FEDERAL 8-lD-65

43-013-50338 FEDERAL 14-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-34285 FEDERAL 14-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51175 FEDERAL 15-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50764 FEDERAL 15-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50553 FEDERAL 15-5D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-51176 FEDERAL 16-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33490 FEDERAL 16-5-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50266 FEDERAL 1-6-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51233 FEDERAL 2-11D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50759 FEDERAL 2-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33385 FEDERAL 2-2-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34018 FEDERAL 2-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-34286 FEDERAL 2-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51093 FEDERAL 3-12D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50760 FEDERAL 3-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34001 FEDERAL 3-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50782 FEDERAL 3-4D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-34287 FEDERAL 3-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50268 FEDERAL 3-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51094 FEDERAL 4-12D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50736 FEDERAL 4-3D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50521 FEDERAL 4-4D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50263 FEDERAL 4-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-50267 FEDERAL 4-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51095 FEDERAL 5-12D-65 UTU-77330
43-013-50761 FEDERAL 5-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33448 FEDERAL 5-3-64 UTU-77321
43-013-33450 FEDERAL 5-4-64 UTU-77326
43-013-33387 FEDERAL 5-4-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50259 FEDERAL 5-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-33489 FEDERAL 5-6-65 UTU-77327
43-013-50269 FEDERAL 5-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-33491 FEDERAL 6-11-65 UTU-77330
43-013-51096 FEDERAL 6-12D-65 UTU-77330
43-013-32699 FEDERAL 6-1-65 UTU-77325
43-013-32557 FEDERAL 6-2-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50522 FEDERAL 6-3D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-34288 FEDERAL 6-5D-64 UTU-8894A
43-013-33745 FEDERAL 6-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50566 FEDERAL 6-6D-65 UTU-77327
43-013-34061 FEDERAL 7-11D-65 UTU-77330
43-013-34015 FEDERAL 7-lD-65 UTU-77325
43-013-50734 FEDERAL 7-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50525 FEDERAL 7-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34065 FEDERAL 7-3D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-34020 FEDERAL 7-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-51232 FEDERAL 8-11D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-33449 FEDERAL 8-1-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50350 FEDERAL 8-lD-65



43-013-33581 FEDERAL 8-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50719 FEDERAL 8-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50325 FEDERAL 8-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50342 FEDERAL 9-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50762 FEDERAL 9-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-51218 FEDERAL 9-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-32351 FOY TRIBAL 11-34-55 UTU-76968
43-013-33799 FOY TRIBAL 12H-33-55 FEE
43-013-51288 LC FEE 10-28D-56 FEE
43-013-50994 LC FEE 10-31D-45 FEE
43-013-50965 LC FEE 1-22-57 FEE
43-013-50718 LC FEE 1-22D-56 FEE
43-013-51371 LC FEE 1-31D-45 FEE
43-013-50929 LC FEE 13-29-45 FEE
43-013-50870 LC FEE 15-23D-56 FEE
43-013-50601 LC FEE 16-16D-56 FEE
43-013-50777 LC FEE 2-20D-56 FEE
43-013-33593 LC FEE 6-12-57 FEE
43-013-50867 LC FEE 8-28D-56 FEE
43-013-50928 LC FEE 8-29-45 FEE
43-013-50963 LC FEE 9-12D-57 FEE
43-013-51192 LC FEE 9-19-56 FEE
43-013-50602 LC TRIBAL 10-16D-56 14-20-H62-6301
43-013-50999 LC TRIBAL 10-21-56 14-20-H62-3433
43-013-33677 LC TRIBAL 11-17-56 14-20-H62-6300
43-013-50751 LC TRIBAL ll-3D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-50780 LC TRIBAL 12-22D-56 14-20-H62-6302
43-013-33606 LC TRIBAL 12H-6-56 14-20-H62-5500
43-013-34282 LC TRIBAL 13-16D-56 14-20-H62-5623
43-013-33591 LC TRIBAL 13H-3-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-50776 LC TRIBAL 14-14D-56 14-20-H62-6436
43-013-50834 LC TRIBAL 14-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-33492 LC TRIBAL 14-2-56 14-20-H62-6472
43-013-51030 LC TRIBAL 15-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-50606 LC TRIBAL 15-22D-56 14-20-H62-6302
43-013-50871 LC TRIBAL 15-26-56 14-20-H62-6471
43-013-51132 LC TRIBAL 16-30D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33608 LC TRIBAL 1-9-56 14-20-H62-5657
43-013-33538 LC TRIBAL 2-16D-56 14-20-H62-5623
43-013-51429 LC TRIBAL 2-28D-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-50866 LC TRIBAL 2-28D-56 14-20-H62-6473
43-013-50925 LC TRIBAL 2-5D-56 14-20-H62-6432
43-013-50926 LC TRIBAL 2-9D-56 14-20-H62-5657
43-013-50598 LC TRIBAL 3-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-33541 LC TRIBAL 3-17-56 14-20-H62-5655
43-013-50751 LC TRIBAL 3-21D-56 14-20-H62-3433
43-013-50976 LC TRIBAL 3-34-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33580 LC TRIBAL 3-5-56 14-20-H62-6257
43-013-33539 LC TRIBAL 4-16-56

43-013-33581 FEDERAL 8-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50719 FEDERAL 8-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50325 FEDERAL 8-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50342 FEDERAL 9-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50762 FEDERAL 9-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-51218 FEDERAL 9-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-32351 FOY TRIBAL 11-34-55 UTU-76968
43-013-33799 FOY TRIBAL 12H-33-55 FEE
43-013-51288 LC FEE 10-28D-56 FEE
43-013-50994 LC FEE 10-31D-45 FEE
43-013-50965 LC FEE 1-22-57 FEE
43-013-50718 LC FEE 1-22D-56 FEE
43-013-51371 LC FEE 1-31D-45 FEE
43-013-50929 LC FEE 13-29-45 FEE
43-013-50870 LC FEE 15-23D-56 FEE
43-013-50601 LC FEE 16-16D-56 FEE
43-013-50777 LC FEE 2-20D-56 FEE
43-013-33593 LC FEE 6-12-57 FEE
43-013-50867 LC FEE 8-28D-56 FEE
43-013-50928 LC FEE 8-29-45 FEE
43-013-50963 LC FEE 9-12D-57 FEE
43-013-51192 LC FEE 9-19-56 FEE
43-013-50602 LC TRIBAL 10-16D-56 14-20-H62-6301
43-013-50999 LC TRIBAL 10-21-56 14-20-H62-3433
43-013-33677 LC TRIBAL 11-17-56 14-20-H62-6300
43-013-50751 LC TRIBAL ll-3D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-50780 LC TRIBAL 12-22D-56 14-20-H62-6302
43-013-33606 LC TRIBAL 12H-6-56 14-20-H62-5500
43-013-34282 LC TRIBAL 13-16D-56 14-20-H62-5623
43-013-33591 LC TRIBAL 13H-3-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-50776 LC TRIBAL 14-14D-56 14-20-H62-6436
43-013-50834 LC TRIBAL 14-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-33492 LC TRIBAL 14-2-56 14-20-H62-6472
43-013-51030 LC TRIBAL 15-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-50606 LC TRIBAL 15-22D-56 14-20-H62-6302
43-013-50871 LC TRIBAL 15-26-56 14-20-H62-6471
43-013-51132 LC TRIBAL 16-30D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33608 LC TRIBAL 1-9-56 14-20-H62-5657
43-013-33538 LC TRIBAL 2-16D-56 14-20-H62-5623
43-013-51429 LC TRIBAL 2-28D-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-50866 LC TRIBAL 2-28D-56 14-20-H62-6473
43-013-50925 LC TRIBAL 2-5D-56 14-20-H62-6432
43-013-50926 LC TRIBAL 2-9D-56 14-20-H62-5657
43-013-50598 LC TRIBAL 3-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-33541 LC TRIBAL 3-17-56 14-20-H62-5655
43-013-50751 LC TRIBAL 3-21D-56 14-20-H62-3433
43-013-50976 LC TRIBAL 3-34-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33580 LC TRIBAL 3-5-56 14-20-H62-6257
43-013-33539 LC TRIBAL 4-16-56

43-013-33581 FEDERAL 8-2D-64 UTU-77321
43-013-50719 FEDERAL 8-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50325 FEDERAL 8-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-50342 FEDERAL 9-lD-65 UTU-77326
43-013-50762 FEDERAL 9-2D-65 UTU-77326
43-013-51218 FEDERAL 9-6D-64 UTU-77322
43-013-32351 FOY TRIBAL 11-34-55 UTU-76968
43-013-33799 FOY TRIBAL 12H-33-55 FEE
43-013-51288 LC FEE 10-28D-56 FEE
43-013-50994 LC FEE 10-31D-45 FEE
43-013-50965 LC FEE 1-22-57 FEE
43-013-50718 LC FEE 1-22D-56 FEE
43-013-51371 LC FEE 1-31D-45 FEE
43-013-50929 LC FEE 13-29-45 FEE
43-013-50870 LC FEE 15-23D-56 FEE
43-013-50601 LC FEE 16-16D-56 FEE
43-013-50777 LC FEE 2-20D-56 FEE
43-013-33593 LC FEE 6-12-57 FEE
43-013-50867 LC FEE 8-28D-56 FEE
43-013-50928 LC FEE 8-29-45 FEE
43-013-50963 LC FEE 9-12D-57 FEE
43-013-51192 LC FEE 9-19-56 FEE
43-013-50602 LC TRIBAL 10-16D-56 14-20-H62-6301
43-013-50999 LC TRIBAL 10-21-56 14-20-H62-3433
43-013-33677 LC TRIBAL 11-17-56 14-20-H62-6300
43-013-50751 LC TRIBAL ll-3D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-50780 LC TRIBAL 12-22D-56 14-20-H62-6302
43-013-33606 LC TRIBAL 12H-6-56 14-20-H62-5500
43-013-34282 LC TRIBAL 13-16D-56 14-20-H62-5623
43-013-33591 LC TRIBAL 13H-3-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-50776 LC TRIBAL 14-14D-56 14-20-H62-6436
43-013-50834 LC TRIBAL 14-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-33492 LC TRIBAL 14-2-56 14-20-H62-6472
43-013-51030 LC TRIBAL 15-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-50606 LC TRIBAL 15-22D-56 14-20-H62-6302
43-013-50871 LC TRIBAL 15-26-56 14-20-H62-6471
43-013-51132 LC TRIBAL 16-30D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33608 LC TRIBAL 1-9-56 14-20-H62-5657
43-013-33538 LC TRIBAL 2-16D-56 14-20-H62-5623
43-013-51429 LC TRIBAL 2-28D-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-50866 LC TRIBAL 2-28D-56 14-20-H62-6473
43-013-50925 LC TRIBAL 2-5D-56 14-20-H62-6432
43-013-50926 LC TRIBAL 2-9D-56 14-20-H62-5657
43-013-50598 LC TRIBAL 3-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-33541 LC TRIBAL 3-17-56 14-20-H62-5655
43-013-50751 LC TRIBAL 3-21D-56 14-20-H62-3433
43-013-50976 LC TRIBAL 3-34-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33580 LC TRIBAL 3-5-56 14-20-H62-6257
43-013-33539 LC TRIBAL 4-16-56



43-013-50262 LC TRIBAL 4-27D-56 14-20-H62-6303
43-013-50661 LC TRIBAL 5-14D-56 14-20-H62-6436
43-013-50752 LC TRIBAL 5-21D-56 14-20-H62-3433
43-013-50625 LC TRIBAL 5-23D-56 14-20-H62-6434
43-013-50260 LC TRIBAL 6-22D-56 14-20-H62-6302
43-013-50868 LC TRIBAL 6-27D-56 14-20-H62-6303
43-013-51034 LC TRIBAL 6-28-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51073 LC TRIBAL 7-27-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33577 LC TRIBAL 7-3-56 14-20-H62-5656
43-013-50599 LC TRIBAL 8-16D-56 14-20-H62-6301
43-013-33576 LC TRIBAL 8-28-46 14-20-H62-5500
43-013-51131 LC TRIBAL 8-30D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33605 LC TRIBAL 8-4-56 14-20-H62-6256
43-013-51031 LC TRIBAL 9-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-51430 LC TRIBAL 9-28D-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51112 LC TRIBAL 9-8D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51198 LC TRIBAL 9-9D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51076 LC Tribal 11-24-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-32931 MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 14-20-H62-3404
43-013-32540 MOON TRIBAL 10-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32845 MOON TRIBAL 11-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32347 MOON TRIBAL 12-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32541 MOON TRIBAL 12-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32937 MOON TRIBAL 1-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32801 MOON TRIBAL 13-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32408 MOON TRIBAL 14-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32846 MOON TRIBAL 15-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32927 MOON TRIBAL 16-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-34109 MOON TRIBAL 16-27D-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32613 MOON TRIBAL 3-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32800 MOON TRIBAL 4-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32938 MOON TRIBAL 5-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32802 MOON TRIBAL 5-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32843 MOON TRIBAL 6-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32407 MOON TRIBAL 6-27-54 14-20-H62-3375

I
43-013-33365 MOON TRIBAL 7-27D-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32543 MOON TRIBAL 8-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32782 MYRIN TRIBAL 14-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-32934 MYRIN TRIBAL 16-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-33152 NIELSEN FEE 13-11-56 14-20-H62-5620
43-013-32737 NIELSEN MARSING 13-14-56 FEE
43-013-31131 S BRUNDAGE CYN UTE TRIBAL 4-27 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-30948 S BRUNDAGE UTE TRIBAL 1-30 14-20-H62-3417
43-013-30933 S COTTONWOOD RIDGE UTE TRIBAL 1-19 14-20-H62-4919
43-007-30890 SCOFIELD THORPE 22-41X RIG SKID FEE
43-007-31001 SCOFIELD-THORPE 23-31 FEE
43-007-30991 SCOFIELD-THORPE 35-13 FEE
43-013-50686 SFW FEE 14-10D-54 FEE
43-013-50247 SFW FEE 15-10-54

43-013-50262 LC TRIBAL 4-27D-56 14-20-H62-6303
43-013-50661 LC TRIBAL 5-14D-56 14-20-H62-6436
43-013-50752 LC TRIBAL 5-21D-56 14-20-H62-3433
43-013-50625 LC TRIBAL 5-23D-56 14-20-H62-6434
43-013-50260 LC TRIBAL 6-22D-56 14-20-H62-6302
43-013-50868 LC TRIBAL 6-27D-56 14-20-H62-6303
43-013-51034 LC TRIBAL 6-28-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51073 LC TRIBAL 7-27-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33577 LC TRIBAL 7-3-56 14-20-H62-5656
43-013-50599 LC TRIBAL 8-16D-56 14-20-H62-6301
43-013-33576 LC TRIBAL 8-28-46 14-20-H62-5500
43-013-51131 LC TRIBAL 8-30D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33605 LC TRIBAL 8-4-56 14-20-H62-6256
43-013-51031 LC TRIBAL 9-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-51430 LC TRIBAL 9-28D-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51112 LC TRIBAL 9-8D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51198 LC TRIBAL 9-9D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51076 LC Tribal 11-24-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-32931 MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 14-20-H62-3404
43-013-32540 MOON TRIBAL 10-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32845 MOON TRIBAL 11-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32347 MOON TRIBAL 12-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32541 MOON TRIBAL 12-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32937 MOON TRIBAL 1-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32801 MOON TRIBAL 13-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32408 MOON TRIBAL 14-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32846 MOON TRIBAL 15-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32927 MOON TRIBAL 16-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-34109 MOON TRIBAL 16-27D-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32613 MOON TRIBAL 3-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32800 MOON TRIBAL 4-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32938 MOON TRIBAL 5-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32802 MOON TRIBAL 5-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32843 MOON TRIBAL 6-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32407 MOON TRIBAL 6-27-54 14-20-H62-3375

I
43-013-33365 MOON TRIBAL 7-27D-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32543 MOON TRIBAL 8-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32782 MYRIN TRIBAL 14-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-32934 MYRIN TRIBAL 16-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-33152 NIELSEN FEE 13-11-56 14-20-H62-5620
43-013-32737 NIELSEN MARSING 13-14-56 FEE
43-013-31131 S BRUNDAGE CYN UTE TRIBAL 4-27 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-30948 S BRUNDAGE UTE TRIBAL 1-30 14-20-H62-3417
43-013-30933 S COTTONWOOD RIDGE UTE TRIBAL 1-19 14-20-H62-4919
43-007-30890 SCOFIELD THORPE 22-41X RIG SKID FEE
43-007-31001 SCOFIELD-THORPE 23-31 FEE
43-007-30991 SCOFIELD-THORPE 35-13 FEE
43-013-50686 SFW FEE 14-10D-54 FEE
43-013-50247 SFW FEE 15-10-54

43-013-50262 LC TRIBAL 4-27D-56 14-20-H62-6303
43-013-50661 LC TRIBAL 5-14D-56 14-20-H62-6436
43-013-50752 LC TRIBAL 5-21D-56 14-20-H62-3433
43-013-50625 LC TRIBAL 5-23D-56 14-20-H62-6434
43-013-50260 LC TRIBAL 6-22D-56 14-20-H62-6302
43-013-50868 LC TRIBAL 6-27D-56 14-20-H62-6303
43-013-51034 LC TRIBAL 6-28-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51073 LC TRIBAL 7-27-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33577 LC TRIBAL 7-3-56 14-20-H62-5656
43-013-50599 LC TRIBAL 8-16D-56 14-20-H62-6301
43-013-33576 LC TRIBAL 8-28-46 14-20-H62-5500
43-013-51131 LC TRIBAL 8-30D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-33605 LC TRIBAL 8-4-56 14-20-H62-6256
43-013-51031 LC TRIBAL 9-15D-56 14-20-H62-6435
43-013-51430 LC TRIBAL 9-28D-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51112 LC TRIBAL 9-8D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51198 LC TRIBAL 9-9D-56 2OG-000-5500
43-013-51076 LC Tribal 11-24-45 2OG-000-5500
43-013-32931 MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 14-20-H62-3404
43-013-32540 MOON TRIBAL 10-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32845 MOON TRIBAL 11-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32347 MOON TRIBAL 12-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32541 MOON TRIBAL 12-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32937 MOON TRIBAL 1-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32801 MOON TRIBAL 13-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32408 MOON TRIBAL 14-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32846 MOON TRIBAL 15-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32927 MOON TRIBAL 16-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-34109 MOON TRIBAL 16-27D-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32613 MOON TRIBAL 3-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32800 MOON TRIBAL 4-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32938 MOON TRIBAL 5-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32802 MOON TRIBAL 5-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32843 MOON TRIBAL 6-23-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32407 MOON TRIBAL 6-27-54 14-20-H62-3375

I
43-013-33365 MOON TRIBAL 7-27D-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32543 MOON TRIBAL 8-27-54 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-32782 MYRIN TRIBAL 14-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-32934 MYRIN TRIBAL 16-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-33152 NIELSEN FEE 13-11-56 14-20-H62-5620
43-013-32737 NIELSEN MARSING 13-14-56 FEE
43-013-31131 S BRUNDAGE CYN UTE TRIBAL 4-27 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-30948 S BRUNDAGE UTE TRIBAL 1-30 14-20-H62-3417
43-013-30933 S COTTONWOOD RIDGE UTE TRIBAL 1-19 14-20-H62-4919
43-007-30890 SCOFIELD THORPE 22-41X RIG SKID FEE
43-007-31001 SCOFIELD-THORPE 23-31 FEE
43-007-30991 SCOFIELD-THORPE 35-13 FEE
43-013-50686 SFW FEE 14-10D-54 FEE
43-013-50247 SFW FEE 15-10-54



43-013-34295 SFW TRIBAL 10-10D-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-34296 SFW TRIBAL 9-10D-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-31701 SOWERS CANYON 9-27 14-20-H62-4753/UTU-76967
43-013-30955 SOWERS CYN UTE TRIBAL 3-26 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33916 ST TRIBAL 1-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32849 ST TRIBAL 2-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-34059 ST TRIBAL 3-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32850 ST TRIBAL 4-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-34060 ST TRIBAL 5-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32848 ST TRIBAL 6-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-33950 ST TRIBAL 7-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32851 ST TRIBAL 8-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-33951 ST TRIBAL 9-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-50245 STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-32953 STATE TRIBAL 5-18-54 14-20-H62-5035
43-013-32952 STATE TRIBAL 7-18-54 14-20-H62-5035
43-013-30999 TC UTE TRIBAL 9-23X 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31699 TABBY CANYON 1-21 14-20-H62-4825/UTU-76965
43-013-31700 TABBY CANYON 8-22 14-20-H62-4754/UTU-76966
43-013-30945 TABBY CYN UTE TRIBAL 1-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33121 TAYLOR FEE 13-22-56 FEE
43-013-33140 TAYLOR FEE 7-14-56 FEE
43-013-32738 TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 FEE
43-013-51271 UTE FEE 14-9D-54 FEE
43-013-51272 UTE FEE 15-9D-54 FEE
43-013-33720 UTE FEE 2-13-55 FEE
43-013-51259 UTE FEE 9-9-54 FEE
43-013-33055 UTE TRIBAL 10-12-55 14-20-H62-5056
43-013-33205 UTE TRIBAL 10-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32601 UTE TRIBAL 10-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32587 UTE TRIBAL 10-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32977 UTE TRIBAL 10-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33129 UTE TRIBAL 10-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32345 UTE TRIBAL 10-16-55 14-20-H62-5024
43-013-33133 UTE TRIBAL 10-17-54 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-33300 UTE TRIBAL 10-18-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32717 UTE TRIBAL 10-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32740 UTE TRIBAL 10-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32603 UTE TRIBAL 10-21-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32592 UTE TRIBAL 10-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33722 UTE TRIBAL 10-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33358 UTE TRIBAL 10-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32932 UTE TRIBAL 10-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-33156 UTE TRIBAL 10-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32749 UTE TRIBAL 10-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33620 UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33360 UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33683 UTE TRIBAL 10-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32764 UTE TRIBAL 10-28-54

43-013-34295 SFW TRIBAL 10-10D-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-34296 SFW TRIBAL 9-10D-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-31701 SOWERS CANYON 9-27 14-20-H62-4753/UTU-76967
43-013-30955 SOWERS CYN UTE TRIBAL 3-26 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33916 ST TRIBAL 1-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32849 ST TRIBAL 2-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-34059 ST TRIBAL 3-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32850 ST TRIBAL 4-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-34060 ST TRIBAL 5-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32848 ST TRIBAL 6-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-33950 ST TRIBAL 7-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32851 ST TRIBAL 8-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-33951 ST TRIBAL 9-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-50245 STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-32953 STATE TRIBAL 5-18-54 14-20-H62-5035
43-013-32952 STATE TRIBAL 7-18-54 14-20-H62-5035
43-013-30999 TC UTE TRIBAL 9-23X 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31699 TABBY CANYON 1-21 14-20-H62-4825/UTU-76965
43-013-31700 TABBY CANYON 8-22 14-20-H62-4754/UTU-76966
43-013-30945 TABBY CYN UTE TRIBAL 1-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33121 TAYLOR FEE 13-22-56 FEE
43-013-33140 TAYLOR FEE 7-14-56 FEE
43-013-32738 TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 FEE
43-013-51271 UTE FEE 14-9D-54 FEE
43-013-51272 UTE FEE 15-9D-54 FEE
43-013-33720 UTE FEE 2-13-55 FEE
43-013-51259 UTE FEE 9-9-54 FEE
43-013-33055 UTE TRIBAL 10-12-55 14-20-H62-5056
43-013-33205 UTE TRIBAL 10-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32601 UTE TRIBAL 10-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32587 UTE TRIBAL 10-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32977 UTE TRIBAL 10-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33129 UTE TRIBAL 10-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32345 UTE TRIBAL 10-16-55 14-20-H62-5024
43-013-33133 UTE TRIBAL 10-17-54 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-33300 UTE TRIBAL 10-18-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32717 UTE TRIBAL 10-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32740 UTE TRIBAL 10-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32603 UTE TRIBAL 10-21-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32592 UTE TRIBAL 10-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33722 UTE TRIBAL 10-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33358 UTE TRIBAL 10-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32932 UTE TRIBAL 10-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-33156 UTE TRIBAL 10-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32749 UTE TRIBAL 10-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33620 UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33360 UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33683 UTE TRIBAL 10-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32764 UTE TRIBAL 10-28-54

43-013-34295 SFW TRIBAL 10-10D-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-34296 SFW TRIBAL 9-10D-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-31701 SOWERS CANYON 9-27 14-20-H62-4753/UTU-76967
43-013-30955 SOWERS CYN UTE TRIBAL 3-26 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33916 ST TRIBAL 1-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32849 ST TRIBAL 2-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-34059 ST TRIBAL 3-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32850 ST TRIBAL 4-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-34060 ST TRIBAL 5-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32848 ST TRIBAL 6-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-33950 ST TRIBAL 7-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32851 ST TRIBAL 8-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-33951 ST TRIBAL 9-15D-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-50245 STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-32953 STATE TRIBAL 5-18-54 14-20-H62-5035
43-013-32952 STATE TRIBAL 7-18-54 14-20-H62-5035
43-013-30999 TC UTE TRIBAL 9-23X 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31699 TABBY CANYON 1-21 14-20-H62-4825/UTU-76965
43-013-31700 TABBY CANYON 8-22 14-20-H62-4754/UTU-76966
43-013-30945 TABBY CYN UTE TRIBAL 1-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33121 TAYLOR FEE 13-22-56 FEE
43-013-33140 TAYLOR FEE 7-14-56 FEE
43-013-32738 TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 FEE
43-013-51271 UTE FEE 14-9D-54 FEE
43-013-51272 UTE FEE 15-9D-54 FEE
43-013-33720 UTE FEE 2-13-55 FEE
43-013-51259 UTE FEE 9-9-54 FEE
43-013-33055 UTE TRIBAL 10-12-55 14-20-H62-5056
43-013-33205 UTE TRIBAL 10-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32601 UTE TRIBAL 10-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32587 UTE TRIBAL 10-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32977 UTE TRIBAL 10-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33129 UTE TRIBAL 10-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32345 UTE TRIBAL 10-16-55 14-20-H62-5024
43-013-33133 UTE TRIBAL 10-17-54 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-33300 UTE TRIBAL 10-18-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32717 UTE TRIBAL 10-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32740 UTE TRIBAL 10-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32603 UTE TRIBAL 10-21-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32592 UTE TRIBAL 10-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33722 UTE TRIBAL 10-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33358 UTE TRIBAL 10-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32932 UTE TRIBAL 10-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-33156 UTE TRIBAL 10-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32749 UTE TRIBAL 10-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33620 UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33360 UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33683 UTE TRIBAL 10-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32764 UTE TRIBAL 10-28-54



43-013-32419 UTE TRIBAL 10-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33155 UTE TRIBAL 10-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33157 UTE TRIBAL 10-29D-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32847 UTE TRIBAL 10-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32936 UTE TRIBAL 10-31-55 14-20-H62-5060
43-013-33902 UTE TRIBAL 10-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33092 UTE TRIBAL 10-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32353 UTE TRIBAL 10-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-33968 UTE TRIBAL 10-36D-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50854 UTE TRIBAL 10S-21D-54 14-20-H62-3141
43-013-32721 UTE TRIBAL 11-12-55 14-20-H62-5518
43-013-32568 UTE TRIBAL 11-13-54 14-20-H62-4894
43-013-33268 UTE TRIBAL 11-13-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-32693 UTE TRIBAL 11-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-33206 UTE TRIBAL 11-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32980 UTE TRIBAL 11-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-32589 UTE TRIBAL 11-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32145 UTE TRIBAL 11-17 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-31547 UTE TRIBAL 11-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32168 UTE TRIBAL 11-20 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32415 UTE TRIBAL 11-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-33115 UTE TRIBAL 11-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-33116 UTE TRIBAL 11-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-32607 UTE TRIBAL 11-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32269 UTE TRIBAL 11-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31909 UTE TRIBAL 11-24 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-31911 UTE TRIBAL 11-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32856 UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32990 UTE TRIBAL 11-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-32844 UTE TRIBAL 11-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33478 UTE TRIBAL ll-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32615 UTE TRIBAL 11-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32192 UTE TRIBAL 11-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-34057 UTE TRIBAL 11-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32563 UTE TRIBAL 11-29-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-32512 UTE TRIBAL 11-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32530 UTE TRIBAL 11-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-33793 UTE TRIBAL 11-32D-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32522 UTE TRIBAL 11-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-33783 UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33214 UTE TRIBAL ll-36D-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33769 UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-33279 UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32664 UTE TRIBAL 11-5-54 14-20-H62-5516
43-013-32978 UTE TRIBAL 1-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33128 UTE TRIBAL 1-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-30966 UTE TRIBAL 1-20 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32414 UTE TRIBAL 1-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-32369 UTE TRIBAL 12-14-54

43-013-32419 UTE TRIBAL 10-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33155 UTE TRIBAL 10-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33157 UTE TRIBAL 10-29D-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32847 UTE TRIBAL 10-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32936 UTE TRIBAL 10-31-55 14-20-H62-5060
43-013-33902 UTE TRIBAL 10-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33092 UTE TRIBAL 10-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32353 UTE TRIBAL 10-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-33968 UTE TRIBAL 10-36D-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50854 UTE TRIBAL 10S-21D-54 14-20-H62-3141
43-013-32721 UTE TRIBAL 11-12-55 14-20-H62-5518
43-013-32568 UTE TRIBAL 11-13-54 14-20-H62-4894
43-013-33268 UTE TRIBAL 11-13-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-32693 UTE TRIBAL 11-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-33206 UTE TRIBAL 11-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32980 UTE TRIBAL 11-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-32589 UTE TRIBAL 11-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32145 UTE TRIBAL 11-17 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-31547 UTE TRIBAL 11-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32168 UTE TRIBAL 11-20 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32415 UTE TRIBAL 11-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-33115 UTE TRIBAL 11-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-33116 UTE TRIBAL 11-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-32607 UTE TRIBAL 11-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32269 UTE TRIBAL 11-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31909 UTE TRIBAL 11-24 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-31911 UTE TRIBAL 11-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32856 UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32990 UTE TRIBAL 11-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-32844 UTE TRIBAL 11-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33478 UTE TRIBAL ll-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32615 UTE TRIBAL 11-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32192 UTE TRIBAL 11-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-34057 UTE TRIBAL 11-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32563 UTE TRIBAL 11-29-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-32512 UTE TRIBAL 11-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32530 UTE TRIBAL 11-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-33793 UTE TRIBAL 11-32D-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32522 UTE TRIBAL 11-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-33783 UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33214 UTE TRIBAL ll-36D-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33769 UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-33279 UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32664 UTE TRIBAL 11-5-54 14-20-H62-5516
43-013-32978 UTE TRIBAL 1-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33128 UTE TRIBAL 1-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-30966 UTE TRIBAL 1-20 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32414 UTE TRIBAL 1-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-32369 UTE TRIBAL 12-14-54

43-013-32419 UTE TRIBAL 10-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33155 UTE TRIBAL 10-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33157 UTE TRIBAL 10-29D-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32847 UTE TRIBAL 10-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32936 UTE TRIBAL 10-31-55 14-20-H62-5060
43-013-33902 UTE TRIBAL 10-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33092 UTE TRIBAL 10-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32353 UTE TRIBAL 10-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-33968 UTE TRIBAL 10-36D-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50854 UTE TRIBAL 10S-21D-54 14-20-H62-3141
43-013-32721 UTE TRIBAL 11-12-55 14-20-H62-5518
43-013-32568 UTE TRIBAL 11-13-54 14-20-H62-4894
43-013-33268 UTE TRIBAL 11-13-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-32693 UTE TRIBAL 11-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-33206 UTE TRIBAL 11-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32980 UTE TRIBAL 11-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-32589 UTE TRIBAL 11-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32145 UTE TRIBAL 11-17 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-31547 UTE TRIBAL 11-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32168 UTE TRIBAL 11-20 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32415 UTE TRIBAL 11-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-33115 UTE TRIBAL 11-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-33116 UTE TRIBAL 11-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-32607 UTE TRIBAL 11-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32269 UTE TRIBAL 11-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31909 UTE TRIBAL 11-24 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-31911 UTE TRIBAL 11-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32856 UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32990 UTE TRIBAL 11-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-32844 UTE TRIBAL 11-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33478 UTE TRIBAL ll-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32615 UTE TRIBAL 11-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32192 UTE TRIBAL 11-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-34057 UTE TRIBAL 11-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32563 UTE TRIBAL 11-29-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-32512 UTE TRIBAL 11-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32530 UTE TRIBAL 11-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-33793 UTE TRIBAL 11-32D-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32522 UTE TRIBAL 11-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-33783 UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33214 UTE TRIBAL ll-36D-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33769 UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-33279 UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32664 UTE TRIBAL 11-5-54 14-20-H62-5516
43-013-32978 UTE TRIBAL 1-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33128 UTE TRIBAL 1-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-30966 UTE TRIBAL 1-20 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32414 UTE TRIBAL 1-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-32369 UTE TRIBAL 12-14-54



43-013-50476 UTE TRIBAL 12-14D-55 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32205 UTE TRIBAL 12-15 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-32981 UTE TRIBAL 12-15-55 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-33131 UTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32146 UTE TRIBAL 12-17 14-20-H62-5035
43-013-33077 UTE TRIBAL 12-18-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32716 UTE TRIBAL 12-19-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32866 UTE TRIBAL 12-20-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32385 UTE TRIBAL 12-21-54 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-33694 UTE TRIBAL 12-21D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32616 UTE TRIBAL 12-22-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33908 UTE TRIBAL 12-23D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-33134 UTE TRIBAL 12-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32769 UTE TRIBAL 12-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33801 UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-54 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-34118 UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-55 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32765 UTE TRIBAL 12-28-54 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33645 UTE TRIBAL 12-28D-55 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32572 UTE TRIBAL 12-29-54 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-33418 UTE TRIBAL 12-29D-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-33215 UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33626 UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33907 UTE TRIBAL 12-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32925 UTE TRIBAL 12-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33266 UTE TRIBAL 12-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-33090 UTE TRIBAL 12-33-54 14-20-562-4948
43-013-32524 UTE TRIBAL 1-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33782 UTE TRIBAL 12-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32354 UTE TRIBAL 12-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32259 UTE TRIBAL 1-24-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-31912 UTE TRIBAL 1-26 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33680 UTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32416 UTE TRIBAL 1-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-31549 UTE TRIBAL 1-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33784 UTE TRIBAL 1-28D-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33184 UTE TRIBAL 12Q-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32599 UTE TRIBAL 13-13-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-33364 UTE TRIBAL 13-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32600 UTE TRIBAL 13-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32526 UTE TRIBAL 1-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32602 UTE TRIBAL 13-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33039 UTE TRIBAL 13-15D-54 14-20-H662-4661
43-013-32511 UTE TRIBAL 13-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-31546 UTE TRIBAL 13-17 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32571 UTE TRIBAL 13-18-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-31284 UTE TRIBAL 13-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32206 UTE TRIBAL 13-20 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32841 UTE TRIBAL 13-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-33113 UTE TRIBAL 13-21-54

43-013-50476 UTE TRIBAL 12-14D-55 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32205 UTE TRIBAL 12-15 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-32981 UTE TRIBAL 12-15-55 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-33131 UTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32146 UTE TRIBAL 12-17 14-20-H62-5035
43-013-33077 UTE TRIBAL 12-18-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32716 UTE TRIBAL 12-19-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32866 UTE TRIBAL 12-20-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32385 UTE TRIBAL 12-21-54 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-33694 UTE TRIBAL 12-21D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32616 UTE TRIBAL 12-22-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33908 UTE TRIBAL 12-23D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-33134 UTE TRIBAL 12-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32769 UTE TRIBAL 12-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33801 UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-54 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-34118 UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-55 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32765 UTE TRIBAL 12-28-54 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33645 UTE TRIBAL 12-28D-55 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32572 UTE TRIBAL 12-29-54 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-33418 UTE TRIBAL 12-29D-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-33215 UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33626 UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33907 UTE TRIBAL 12-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32925 UTE TRIBAL 12-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33266 UTE TRIBAL 12-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-33090 UTE TRIBAL 12-33-54 14-20-562-4948
43-013-32524 UTE TRIBAL 1-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33782 UTE TRIBAL 12-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32354 UTE TRIBAL 12-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32259 UTE TRIBAL 1-24-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-31912 UTE TRIBAL 1-26 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33680 UTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32416 UTE TRIBAL 1-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-31549 UTE TRIBAL 1-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33784 UTE TRIBAL 1-28D-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33184 UTE TRIBAL 12Q-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32599 UTE TRIBAL 13-13-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-33364 UTE TRIBAL 13-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32600 UTE TRIBAL 13-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32526 UTE TRIBAL 1-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32602 UTE TRIBAL 13-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33039 UTE TRIBAL 13-15D-54 14-20-H662-4661
43-013-32511 UTE TRIBAL 13-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-31546 UTE TRIBAL 13-17 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32571 UTE TRIBAL 13-18-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-31284 UTE TRIBAL 13-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32206 UTE TRIBAL 13-20 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32841 UTE TRIBAL 13-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-33113 UTE TRIBAL 13-21-54

43-013-50476 UTE TRIBAL 12-14D-55 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32205 UTE TRIBAL 12-15 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-32981 UTE TRIBAL 12-15-55 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-33131 UTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32146 UTE TRIBAL 12-17 14-20-H62-5035
43-013-33077 UTE TRIBAL 12-18-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32716 UTE TRIBAL 12-19-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32866 UTE TRIBAL 12-20-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32385 UTE TRIBAL 12-21-54 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-33694 UTE TRIBAL 12-21D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32616 UTE TRIBAL 12-22-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33908 UTE TRIBAL 12-23D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-33134 UTE TRIBAL 12-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32769 UTE TRIBAL 12-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33801 UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-54 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-34118 UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-55 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32765 UTE TRIBAL 12-28-54 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33645 UTE TRIBAL 12-28D-55 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32572 UTE TRIBAL 12-29-54 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-33418 UTE TRIBAL 12-29D-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-33215 UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33626 UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33907 UTE TRIBAL 12-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32925 UTE TRIBAL 12-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33266 UTE TRIBAL 12-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-33090 UTE TRIBAL 12-33-54 14-20-562-4948
43-013-32524 UTE TRIBAL 1-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33782 UTE TRIBAL 12-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32354 UTE TRIBAL 12-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32259 UTE TRIBAL 1-24-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-31912 UTE TRIBAL 1-26 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33680 UTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 14-20-H62-4943
43-013-32416 UTE TRIBAL 1-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-31549 UTE TRIBAL 1-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33784 UTE TRIBAL 1-28D-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33184 UTE TRIBAL 12Q-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32599 UTE TRIBAL 13-13-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-33364 UTE TRIBAL 13-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32600 UTE TRIBAL 13-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32526 UTE TRIBAL 1-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32602 UTE TRIBAL 13-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33039 UTE TRIBAL 13-15D-54 14-20-H662-4661
43-013-32511 UTE TRIBAL 13-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-31546 UTE TRIBAL 13-17 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32571 UTE TRIBAL 13-18-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-31284 UTE TRIBAL 13-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32206 UTE TRIBAL 13-20 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32841 UTE TRIBAL 13-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-33113 UTE TRIBAL 13-21-54



43-013-31548 UTE TRIBAL 13-22 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33716 UTE TRIBAL 13-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32513 UTE TRIBAL 13-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31910 UTE TRIBAL 13-24 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32169 UTE TRIBAL 13-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32891 UTE TRIBAL 13-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-34002 UTE TRIBAL 13-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32387 UTE TRIBAL 13-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33646 UTE TRIBAL 13-28D-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32564 UTE TRIBAL 13-29-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-33501 UTE TRIBAL 1-31-55 14-20-H62-5060
43-013-30872 UTE TRIBAL 1-32R 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32185 UTE TRIBAL 1-33 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32409 UTE TRIBAL 13-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32688 UTE TRIBAL 13-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32692 UTE TRIBAL 13-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32742 UTE TRIBAL 13-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32806 UTE TRIBAL 13-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-34117 UTE TRIBAL 13-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-33624 UTE TRIBAL 13-36D-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32186 UTE TRIBAL 1-34 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-50408 UTE TRIBAL 1-34D-55 14-20-H62-5028
43-013-32567 UTE TRIBAL 1-35-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-33967 UTE TRIBAL 1-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32760 UTE TRIBAL 1-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33380 UTE TRIBAL 13H-16-55 14-20-H62-5024
43-013-33112 UTE TRIBAL 14-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32979 UTE TRIBAL 14-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33123 UTE TRIBAL 14-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32147 UTE TRIBAL 14-17 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32984 UTE TRIBAL 14-18-55 14-20-H62-5057
43-013-32690 UTE TRIBAL 14-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32702 UTE TRIBAL 14-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32384 UTE TRIBAL 14-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32593 UTE TRIBAL 14-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33717 UTE TRIBAL 14-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33915 UTE TRIBAL 14-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33912 UTE TRIBAL 14-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32988 UTE TRIBAL 14-24-56 14-20-H62-5064
43-013-33912 UTE TRIBAL 14-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32776 UTE TRIBAL 14-25-54 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32750 UTE TRIBAL 14-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33673 UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33361 UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33684 UTE TRIBAL 14-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32348 UTE TRIBAL 14-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33278 UTE TRIBAL 14-28D-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33042 UTE TRIBAL 14-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32523 UTE TRIBAL 14-32-54

43-013-31548 UTE TRIBAL 13-22 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33716 UTE TRIBAL 13-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32513 UTE TRIBAL 13-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31910 UTE TRIBAL 13-24 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32169 UTE TRIBAL 13-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32891 UTE TRIBAL 13-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-34002 UTE TRIBAL 13-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32387 UTE TRIBAL 13-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33646 UTE TRIBAL 13-28D-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32564 UTE TRIBAL 13-29-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-33501 UTE TRIBAL 1-31-55 14-20-H62-5060
43-013-30872 UTE TRIBAL 1-32R 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32185 UTE TRIBAL 1-33 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32409 UTE TRIBAL 13-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32688 UTE TRIBAL 13-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32692 UTE TRIBAL 13-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32742 UTE TRIBAL 13-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32806 UTE TRIBAL 13-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-34117 UTE TRIBAL 13-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-33624 UTE TRIBAL 13-36D-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32186 UTE TRIBAL 1-34 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-50408 UTE TRIBAL 1-34D-55 14-20-H62-5028
43-013-32567 UTE TRIBAL 1-35-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-33967 UTE TRIBAL 1-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32760 UTE TRIBAL 1-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33380 UTE TRIBAL 13H-16-55 14-20-H62-5024
43-013-33112 UTE TRIBAL 14-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32979 UTE TRIBAL 14-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33123 UTE TRIBAL 14-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32147 UTE TRIBAL 14-17 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32984 UTE TRIBAL 14-18-55 14-20-H62-5057
43-013-32690 UTE TRIBAL 14-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32702 UTE TRIBAL 14-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32384 UTE TRIBAL 14-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32593 UTE TRIBAL 14-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33717 UTE TRIBAL 14-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33915 UTE TRIBAL 14-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33912 UTE TRIBAL 14-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32988 UTE TRIBAL 14-24-56 14-20-H62-5064
43-013-33912 UTE TRIBAL 14-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32776 UTE TRIBAL 14-25-54 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32750 UTE TRIBAL 14-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33673 UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33361 UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33684 UTE TRIBAL 14-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32348 UTE TRIBAL 14-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33278 UTE TRIBAL 14-28D-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33042 UTE TRIBAL 14-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32523 UTE TRIBAL 14-32-54

43-013-31548 UTE TRIBAL 13-22 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33716 UTE TRIBAL 13-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32513 UTE TRIBAL 13-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31910 UTE TRIBAL 13-24 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32169 UTE TRIBAL 13-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32891 UTE TRIBAL 13-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-34002 UTE TRIBAL 13-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32387 UTE TRIBAL 13-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33646 UTE TRIBAL 13-28D-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32564 UTE TRIBAL 13-29-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-33501 UTE TRIBAL 1-31-55 14-20-H62-5060
43-013-30872 UTE TRIBAL 1-32R 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32185 UTE TRIBAL 1-33 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32409 UTE TRIBAL 13-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32688 UTE TRIBAL 13-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32692 UTE TRIBAL 13-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32742 UTE TRIBAL 13-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32806 UTE TRIBAL 13-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-34117 UTE TRIBAL 13-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-33624 UTE TRIBAL 13-36D-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32186 UTE TRIBAL 1-34 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-50408 UTE TRIBAL 1-34D-55 14-20-H62-5028
43-013-32567 UTE TRIBAL 1-35-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-33967 UTE TRIBAL 1-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32760 UTE TRIBAL 1-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33380 UTE TRIBAL 13H-16-55 14-20-H62-5024
43-013-33112 UTE TRIBAL 14-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32979 UTE TRIBAL 14-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33123 UTE TRIBAL 14-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32147 UTE TRIBAL 14-17 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32984 UTE TRIBAL 14-18-55 14-20-H62-5057
43-013-32690 UTE TRIBAL 14-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32702 UTE TRIBAL 14-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32384 UTE TRIBAL 14-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32593 UTE TRIBAL 14-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33717 UTE TRIBAL 14-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33915 UTE TRIBAL 14-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33912 UTE TRIBAL 14-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32988 UTE TRIBAL 14-24-56 14-20-H62-5064
43-013-33912 UTE TRIBAL 14-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32776 UTE TRIBAL 14-25-54 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32750 UTE TRIBAL 14-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33673 UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33361 UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33684 UTE TRIBAL 14-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32348 UTE TRIBAL 14-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33278 UTE TRIBAL 14-28D-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33042 UTE TRIBAL 14-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32523 UTE TRIBAL 14-32-54



43-013-33093 UTE TRIBAL 14-33-54 14-20-H62-4949
43-013-33955 UTE TRIBAL 14-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32355 UTE TRIBAL 14-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33277 UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33479 UTE TRIBAL 14Q-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-33212 UTE TRIBAL 15-13D-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-32971 UTE TRIBAL 15-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32855 UTE TRIBAL 15-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-31648 UTE TRIBAL 15-16 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-31649 UTE TRIBAL 15-17 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-32358 UTE TRIBAL 15-17-55 14-20-H62-5025
43-013-32148 UTE TRIBAL 15-18 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-31832 UTE TRIBAL 15-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32386 UTE TRIBAL 15-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-33357 UTE TRIBAL 15-21-55 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32617 UTE TRIBAL 15-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-34116 UTE TRIBAL 15-22D-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-31671 UTE TRIBAL 15-23 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31129 UTE TRIBAL 15-24R 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32271 UTE TRIBAL 15-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33768 UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33362 UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32339 UTE TRIBAL 15-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32389 UTE TRIBAL 15-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32561 UTE TRIBAL 15-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32382 UTE TRIBAL 15-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32743 UTE TRIBAL 15-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32666 UTE TRIBAL 15-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32768 UTE TRIBAL 15-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32804 UTE TRIBAL 15-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33954 UTE TRIBAL 15-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-33049 UTE TRIBAL 15-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33327 UTE TRIBAL 16-13D-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-32272 UTE TRIBAL 16-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32588 UTE TRIBAL 16-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32757 UTE TRIBAL 16-16-55 14-20-H62-5024
43-013-33132 UTE TRIBAL 16-17-54 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-31650 UTE TRIBAL 16-18 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32691 UTE TRIBAL 16-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32739 UTE TRIBAL 16-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32381 UTE TRIBAL 16-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32842 UTE TRIBAL 16-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33267 UTE TRIBAL 16-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33046 UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 14-20-H-62-3443
43-013-32775 UTE TRIBAL 16-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-32672 UTE TRIBAL 16-24-55 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32759 UTE TRIBAL 16-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-34042 UTE TRIBAL 16-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33965 UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55

43-013-33093 UTE TRIBAL 14-33-54 14-20-H62-4949
43-013-33955 UTE TRIBAL 14-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32355 UTE TRIBAL 14-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33277 UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33479 UTE TRIBAL 14Q-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-33212 UTE TRIBAL 15-13D-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-32971 UTE TRIBAL 15-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32855 UTE TRIBAL 15-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-31648 UTE TRIBAL 15-16 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-31649 UTE TRIBAL 15-17 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-32358 UTE TRIBAL 15-17-55 14-20-H62-5025
43-013-32148 UTE TRIBAL 15-18 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-31832 UTE TRIBAL 15-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32386 UTE TRIBAL 15-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-33357 UTE TRIBAL 15-21-55 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32617 UTE TRIBAL 15-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-34116 UTE TRIBAL 15-22D-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-31671 UTE TRIBAL 15-23 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31129 UTE TRIBAL 15-24R 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32271 UTE TRIBAL 15-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33768 UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33362 UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32339 UTE TRIBAL 15-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32389 UTE TRIBAL 15-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32561 UTE TRIBAL 15-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32382 UTE TRIBAL 15-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32743 UTE TRIBAL 15-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32666 UTE TRIBAL 15-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32768 UTE TRIBAL 15-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32804 UTE TRIBAL 15-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33954 UTE TRIBAL 15-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-33049 UTE TRIBAL 15-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33327 UTE TRIBAL 16-13D-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-32272 UTE TRIBAL 16-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32588 UTE TRIBAL 16-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32757 UTE TRIBAL 16-16-55 14-20-H62-5024
43-013-33132 UTE TRIBAL 16-17-54 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-31650 UTE TRIBAL 16-18 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32691 UTE TRIBAL 16-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32739 UTE TRIBAL 16-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32381 UTE TRIBAL 16-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32842 UTE TRIBAL 16-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33267 UTE TRIBAL 16-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33046 UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 14-20-H-62-3443
43-013-32775 UTE TRIBAL 16-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-32672 UTE TRIBAL 16-24-55 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32759 UTE TRIBAL 16-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-34042 UTE TRIBAL 16-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33965 UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55

43-013-33093 UTE TRIBAL 14-33-54 14-20-H62-4949
43-013-33955 UTE TRIBAL 14-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32355 UTE TRIBAL 14-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33277 UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33479 UTE TRIBAL 14Q-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-33212 UTE TRIBAL 15-13D-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-32971 UTE TRIBAL 15-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32855 UTE TRIBAL 15-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-31648 UTE TRIBAL 15-16 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-31649 UTE TRIBAL 15-17 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-32358 UTE TRIBAL 15-17-55 14-20-H62-5025
43-013-32148 UTE TRIBAL 15-18 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-31832 UTE TRIBAL 15-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32386 UTE TRIBAL 15-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-33357 UTE TRIBAL 15-21-55 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32617 UTE TRIBAL 15-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-34116 UTE TRIBAL 15-22D-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-31671 UTE TRIBAL 15-23 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-31129 UTE TRIBAL 15-24R 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32271 UTE TRIBAL 15-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33768 UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33362 UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32339 UTE TRIBAL 15-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32389 UTE TRIBAL 15-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32561 UTE TRIBAL 15-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32382 UTE TRIBAL 15-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32743 UTE TRIBAL 15-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32666 UTE TRIBAL 15-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32768 UTE TRIBAL 15-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32804 UTE TRIBAL 15-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33954 UTE TRIBAL 15-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-33049 UTE TRIBAL 15-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33327 UTE TRIBAL 16-13D-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-32272 UTE TRIBAL 16-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32588 UTE TRIBAL 16-15-54 14-20-H62-4661
43-013-32757 UTE TRIBAL 16-16-55 14-20-H62-5024
43-013-33132 UTE TRIBAL 16-17-54 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-31650 UTE TRIBAL 16-18 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32691 UTE TRIBAL 16-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32739 UTE TRIBAL 16-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32381 UTE TRIBAL 16-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32842 UTE TRIBAL 16-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33267 UTE TRIBAL 16-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33046 UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 14-20-H-62-3443
43-013-32775 UTE TRIBAL 16-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-32672 UTE TRIBAL 16-24-55 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32759 UTE TRIBAL 16-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-34042 UTE TRIBAL 16-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33965 UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55



43-013-33786 UTE TRIBAL 16-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-33041 UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33076 UTE TRIBAL 16-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32349 UTE TRIBAL 16-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32665 UTE TRIBAL 16-3-54 14-20-H62-4778
43-013-32718 UTE TRIBAL 16-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-33326 UTE TRIBAL 16-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32926 UTE TRIBAL 16-32D-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33091 UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32352 UTE TRIBAL 16-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32356 UTE TRIBAL 16-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33393 UTE TRIBAL 1A-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33186 UTE TRIBAL lI-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33111 UTE TRIBAL 2-14-54 14-20-H962-5033
43-013-32140 UTE TRIBAL 2-19 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32974 UTE TRIBAL 2-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-33117 UTE TRIBAL 2-21-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32591 UTE TRIBAL 2-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-32604 UTE TRIBAL 2-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33045 UTE TRIBAL 2-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32569 UTE TRIBAL 2-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-31833 UTE TRIBAL 2-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32868 UTE TRIBAL 2-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33979 UTE TRIBAL 2-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32179 UTE TRIBAL 2-27 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-33628 UTE TRIBAL 2-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32763 UTE TRIBAL 2-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33714 UTE TRIBAL 2-29D-55 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32680 UTE TRIBAL 2-30-55 14-20-H62-5059
43-013-32894 UTE TRIBAL 2-30D-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32762 UTE TRIBAL 2-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32935 UTE TRIBAL 2-31-55 14-20-H62-5060
43-013-32803 UTE TRIBAL 2-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32350 UTE TRIBAL 2-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-32898 UTE TRIBAL 2-33D-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32187 UTE TRIBAL 2-35 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32422 UTE TRIBAL 2-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32663 UTE TRIBAL 3-10-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-50478 _UTE TRIBAL 3-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-50389 UTE TRIBAL 3-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-31830 UTE TRIBAL 3-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32377 UTE TRIBAL 3-20-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32867 UTE TRIBAL 3-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32758 UTE TRIBAL 3-21-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-33208 UTE TRIBAL 3-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-32605 UTE TRIBAL 3-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32536 UTE TRIBAL 3-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-30960 UTE TRIBAL 3-24R-55 (REENTRY) 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-31834 UTE TRIBAL 3-25

43-013-33786 UTE TRIBAL 16-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-33041 UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33076 UTE TRIBAL 16-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32349 UTE TRIBAL 16-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32665 UTE TRIBAL 16-3-54 14-20-H62-4778
43-013-32718 UTE TRIBAL 16-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-33326 UTE TRIBAL 16-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32926 UTE TRIBAL 16-32D-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33091 UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32352 UTE TRIBAL 16-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32356 UTE TRIBAL 16-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33393 UTE TRIBAL 1A-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33186 UTE TRIBAL lI-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33111 UTE TRIBAL 2-14-54 14-20-H962-5033
43-013-32140 UTE TRIBAL 2-19 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32974 UTE TRIBAL 2-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-33117 UTE TRIBAL 2-21-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32591 UTE TRIBAL 2-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-32604 UTE TRIBAL 2-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33045 UTE TRIBAL 2-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32569 UTE TRIBAL 2-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-31833 UTE TRIBAL 2-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32868 UTE TRIBAL 2-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33979 UTE TRIBAL 2-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32179 UTE TRIBAL 2-27 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-33628 UTE TRIBAL 2-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32763 UTE TRIBAL 2-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33714 UTE TRIBAL 2-29D-55 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32680 UTE TRIBAL 2-30-55 14-20-H62-5059
43-013-32894 UTE TRIBAL 2-30D-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32762 UTE TRIBAL 2-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32935 UTE TRIBAL 2-31-55 14-20-H62-5060
43-013-32803 UTE TRIBAL 2-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32350 UTE TRIBAL 2-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-32898 UTE TRIBAL 2-33D-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32187 UTE TRIBAL 2-35 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32422 UTE TRIBAL 2-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32663 UTE TRIBAL 3-10-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-50478 _UTE TRIBAL 3-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-50389 UTE TRIBAL 3-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-31830 UTE TRIBAL 3-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32377 UTE TRIBAL 3-20-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32867 UTE TRIBAL 3-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32758 UTE TRIBAL 3-21-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-33208 UTE TRIBAL 3-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-32605 UTE TRIBAL 3-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32536 UTE TRIBAL 3-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-30960 UTE TRIBAL 3-24R-55 (REENTRY) 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-31834 UTE TRIBAL 3-25

43-013-33786 UTE TRIBAL 16-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-33041 UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33076 UTE TRIBAL 16-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32349 UTE TRIBAL 16-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32665 UTE TRIBAL 16-3-54 14-20-H62-4778
43-013-32718 UTE TRIBAL 16-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-33326 UTE TRIBAL 16-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32926 UTE TRIBAL 16-32D-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33091 UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32352 UTE TRIBAL 16-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32356 UTE TRIBAL 16-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33393 UTE TRIBAL 1A-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33186 UTE TRIBAL lI-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33111 UTE TRIBAL 2-14-54 14-20-H962-5033
43-013-32140 UTE TRIBAL 2-19 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32974 UTE TRIBAL 2-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-33117 UTE TRIBAL 2-21-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32591 UTE TRIBAL 2-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-32604 UTE TRIBAL 2-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33045 UTE TRIBAL 2-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32569 UTE TRIBAL 2-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-31833 UTE TRIBAL 2-25 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32868 UTE TRIBAL 2-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33979 UTE TRIBAL 2-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32179 UTE TRIBAL 2-27 14-20-H62-3375
43-013-33628 UTE TRIBAL 2-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32763 UTE TRIBAL 2-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33714 UTE TRIBAL 2-29D-55 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32680 UTE TRIBAL 2-30-55 14-20-H62-5059
43-013-32894 UTE TRIBAL 2-30D-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32762 UTE TRIBAL 2-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32935 UTE TRIBAL 2-31-55 14-20-H62-5060
43-013-32803 UTE TRIBAL 2-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32350 UTE TRIBAL 2-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-32898 UTE TRIBAL 2-33D-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32187 UTE TRIBAL 2-35 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32422 UTE TRIBAL 2-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32663 UTE TRIBAL 3-10-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-50478 _UTE TRIBAL 3-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-50389 UTE TRIBAL 3-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-31830 UTE TRIBAL 3-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32377 UTE TRIBAL 3-20-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32867 UTE TRIBAL 3-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32758 UTE TRIBAL 3-21-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-33208 UTE TRIBAL 3-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-32605 UTE TRIBAL 3-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32536 UTE TRIBAL 3-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-30960 UTE TRIBAL 3-24R-55 (REENTRY) 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-31834 UTE TRIBAL 3-25



43-013-32993 UTE TRIBAL 3-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-33681 UTE TRIBAL 3-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-32417 UTE TRIBAL 3-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32261 UTE TRIBAL 3-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33723 UTE TRIBAL 3-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32625 UTE TRIBAL 3-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32862 UTE TRIBAL 3-30-55 14-20-H62-5059
43-013-32527 UTE TRIBAL 3-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32410 UTE TRIBAL 3-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33363 UTE TRIBAL 3-32D-55 14-20-H62-5206
43-013-32412 UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-33888 UTE TRIBAL 3-35D-55 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33888 UTE TRIBAL 3-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32751 UTE TRIBAL 3-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33185 UTE TRIBAL 3G-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-33270 UTE TRIBAL 4-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32972 UTE TRIBAL 4-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32621 UTE TRIBAL 4-20-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-33549 UTE TRIBAL 4-20D-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-32378 UTE TRIBAL 4-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-33044 UTE TRIBAL 4-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33627 UTE TRIBAL 4-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32573 UTE TRIBAL 4-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-33726 UTE TRIBAL 4-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32928 UTE TRIBAL 4-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33595 UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33978 UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33797 UTE TRIBAL 4-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32741 UTE TRIBAL 4-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33118 UTE TRIBAL 4-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32565 UTE TRIBAL 4-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-31550 UTE TRIBAL 4-30 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32767 UTE TRIBAL 4-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32896 UTE TRIBAL 4-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33379 UTE TRIBAL 4-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-32871 UTE TRIBAL 4-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32357 UTE TRIBAL 4-33-55 14-20-H62-5027
43-013-32188 UTE TRIBAL 4-36 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-31152 UTE TRIBAL 5-13 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-33075 UTE TRIBAL 5-13-54 14-20-H62-4894
43-013-33619 UTE TRIBAL 5-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-50479 UTE TRIBAL 5-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32344 UTE TRIBAL 5-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-50475 UTE TRIBAL 5-16D-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32204 UTE TRIBAL 5-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-31651 UTE TRIBAL 5-20 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-33324 UTE TRIBAL 5-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-33706 UTE TRIBAL 5-21D-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32624 UTE TRIBAL 5-22-54

43-013-32993 UTE TRIBAL 3-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-33681 UTE TRIBAL 3-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-32417 UTE TRIBAL 3-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32261 UTE TRIBAL 3-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33723 UTE TRIBAL 3-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32625 UTE TRIBAL 3-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32862 UTE TRIBAL 3-30-55 14-20-H62-5059
43-013-32527 UTE TRIBAL 3-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32410 UTE TRIBAL 3-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33363 UTE TRIBAL 3-32D-55 14-20-H62-5206
43-013-32412 UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-33888 UTE TRIBAL 3-35D-55 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33888 UTE TRIBAL 3-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32751 UTE TRIBAL 3-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33185 UTE TRIBAL 3G-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-33270 UTE TRIBAL 4-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32972 UTE TRIBAL 4-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32621 UTE TRIBAL 4-20-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-33549 UTE TRIBAL 4-20D-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-32378 UTE TRIBAL 4-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-33044 UTE TRIBAL 4-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33627 UTE TRIBAL 4-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32573 UTE TRIBAL 4-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-33726 UTE TRIBAL 4-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32928 UTE TRIBAL 4-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33595 UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33978 UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33797 UTE TRIBAL 4-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32741 UTE TRIBAL 4-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33118 UTE TRIBAL 4-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32565 UTE TRIBAL 4-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-31550 UTE TRIBAL 4-30 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32767 UTE TRIBAL 4-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32896 UTE TRIBAL 4-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33379 UTE TRIBAL 4-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-32871 UTE TRIBAL 4-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32357 UTE TRIBAL 4-33-55 14-20-H62-5027
43-013-32188 UTE TRIBAL 4-36 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-31152 UTE TRIBAL 5-13 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-33075 UTE TRIBAL 5-13-54 14-20-H62-4894
43-013-33619 UTE TRIBAL 5-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-50479 UTE TRIBAL 5-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32344 UTE TRIBAL 5-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-50475 UTE TRIBAL 5-16D-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32204 UTE TRIBAL 5-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-31651 UTE TRIBAL 5-20 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-33324 UTE TRIBAL 5-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-33706 UTE TRIBAL 5-21D-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32624 UTE TRIBAL 5-22-54

43-013-32993 UTE TRIBAL 3-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-33681 UTE TRIBAL 3-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-32417 UTE TRIBAL 3-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32261 UTE TRIBAL 3-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33723 UTE TRIBAL 3-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32625 UTE TRIBAL 3-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32862 UTE TRIBAL 3-30-55 14-20-H62-5059
43-013-32527 UTE TRIBAL 3-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32410 UTE TRIBAL 3-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33363 UTE TRIBAL 3-32D-55 14-20-H62-5206
43-013-32412 UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-33888 UTE TRIBAL 3-35D-55 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33888 UTE TRIBAL 3-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32751 UTE TRIBAL 3-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33185 UTE TRIBAL 3G-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-33270 UTE TRIBAL 4-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32972 UTE TRIBAL 4-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32621 UTE TRIBAL 4-20-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-33549 UTE TRIBAL 4-20D-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-32378 UTE TRIBAL 4-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-33044 UTE TRIBAL 4-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-33627 UTE TRIBAL 4-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32573 UTE TRIBAL 4-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-33726 UTE TRIBAL 4-24D-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32928 UTE TRIBAL 4-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33595 UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33978 UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-33797 UTE TRIBAL 4-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32741 UTE TRIBAL 4-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33118 UTE TRIBAL 4-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32565 UTE TRIBAL 4-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-31550 UTE TRIBAL 4-30 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32767 UTE TRIBAL 4-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32896 UTE TRIBAL 4-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-33379 UTE TRIBAL 4-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-32871 UTE TRIBAL 4-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32357 UTE TRIBAL 4-33-55 14-20-H62-5027
43-013-32188 UTE TRIBAL 4-36 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-31152 UTE TRIBAL 5-13 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-33075 UTE TRIBAL 5-13-54 14-20-H62-4894
43-013-33619 UTE TRIBAL 5-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-50479 UTE TRIBAL 5-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32344 UTE TRIBAL 5-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-50475 UTE TRIBAL 5-16D-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32204 UTE TRIBAL 5-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-31651 UTE TRIBAL 5-20 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-33324 UTE TRIBAL 5-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-33706 UTE TRIBAL 5-21D-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32624 UTE TRIBAL 5-22-54



43-013-32537 UTE TRIBAL 5-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32263 UTE TRIBAL 5-24-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32992 UTE TRIBAL 5-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-33421 UTE TRIBAL 5-25D-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32890 UTE TRIBAL 5-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-32264 UTE TRIBAL 5-26-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32614 UTE TRIBAL 5-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32189 UTE TRIBAL 5-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32525 UTE TRIBAL 5-29-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-32380 UTE TRIBAL 5-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32190 UTE TRIBAL 5-31 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32539 UTE TRIBAL 5-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32521 UTE TRIBAL 5-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32805 UTE TRIBAL 5-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-32930 UTE TRIBAL 5-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32586 UTE TRIBAL 6-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-50246 UTE TRIBAL 6-14D-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32865 UTE TRIBAL 6-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32622 UTE TRIBAL 6-20-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32164 UTE TRIBAL 6-21 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32163 UTE TRIBAL 6-22 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33213 UTE TRIBAL 6-22D-55 14-20-H62-4728
43-013-33187 UTE TRIBAL 6-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32570 UTE TRIBAL 6-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-32143 UTE TRIBAL 6-25H 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33625 UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33476 UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32892 UTE TRIBAL 6-28D-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33172 UTE TRIBAL 6-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33120 UTE TRIBAL 6-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32783 UTE TRIBAL 6-30-55 14-20-H62-5059
43-013-33325 UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32420 UTE TRIBAL 6-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-32897 UTE TRIBAL 6-32D-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32872 UTE TRIBAL 6-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-34028 UTE TRIBAL 6-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32265 UTE TRIBAL 6-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50409 UTE TRIBAL 7-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-33269 UTE TRIBAL 7-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32976 UTE TRIBAL 7-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33130 UTE TRIBAL 7-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32863 UTE TRIBAL 7-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-32346 UTE TRIBAL 7-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-31281 UTE TRIBAL 7-20R-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32623 UTE TRIBAL 7-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32761 UTE TRIBAL 7-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33721 UTE TRIBAL 7-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32514 UTE TRIBAL 7-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32991 UTE TRIBAL 7-24-56

43-013-32537 UTE TRIBAL 5-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32263 UTE TRIBAL 5-24-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32992 UTE TRIBAL 5-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-33421 UTE TRIBAL 5-25D-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32890 UTE TRIBAL 5-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-32264 UTE TRIBAL 5-26-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32614 UTE TRIBAL 5-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32189 UTE TRIBAL 5-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32525 UTE TRIBAL 5-29-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-32380 UTE TRIBAL 5-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32190 UTE TRIBAL 5-31 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32539 UTE TRIBAL 5-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32521 UTE TRIBAL 5-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32805 UTE TRIBAL 5-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-32930 UTE TRIBAL 5-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32586 UTE TRIBAL 6-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-50246 UTE TRIBAL 6-14D-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32865 UTE TRIBAL 6-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32622 UTE TRIBAL 6-20-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32164 UTE TRIBAL 6-21 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32163 UTE TRIBAL 6-22 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33213 UTE TRIBAL 6-22D-55 14-20-H62-4728
43-013-33187 UTE TRIBAL 6-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32570 UTE TRIBAL 6-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-32143 UTE TRIBAL 6-25H 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33625 UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33476 UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32892 UTE TRIBAL 6-28D-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33172 UTE TRIBAL 6-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33120 UTE TRIBAL 6-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32783 UTE TRIBAL 6-30-55 14-20-H62-5059
43-013-33325 UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32420 UTE TRIBAL 6-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-32897 UTE TRIBAL 6-32D-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32872 UTE TRIBAL 6-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-34028 UTE TRIBAL 6-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32265 UTE TRIBAL 6-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50409 UTE TRIBAL 7-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-33269 UTE TRIBAL 7-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32976 UTE TRIBAL 7-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33130 UTE TRIBAL 7-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32863 UTE TRIBAL 7-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-32346 UTE TRIBAL 7-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-31281 UTE TRIBAL 7-20R-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32623 UTE TRIBAL 7-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32761 UTE TRIBAL 7-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33721 UTE TRIBAL 7-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32514 UTE TRIBAL 7-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32991 UTE TRIBAL 7-24-56

43-013-32537 UTE TRIBAL 5-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32263 UTE TRIBAL 5-24-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32992 UTE TRIBAL 5-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-33421 UTE TRIBAL 5-25D-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32890 UTE TRIBAL 5-26-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-32264 UTE TRIBAL 5-26-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32614 UTE TRIBAL 5-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32189 UTE TRIBAL 5-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32525 UTE TRIBAL 5-29-54 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-32380 UTE TRIBAL 5-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32190 UTE TRIBAL 5-31 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32539 UTE TRIBAL 5-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32521 UTE TRIBAL 5-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32805 UTE TRIBAL 5-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-32930 UTE TRIBAL 5-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-32586 UTE TRIBAL 6-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-50246 UTE TRIBAL 6-14D-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32865 UTE TRIBAL 6-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32622 UTE TRIBAL 6-20-54 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-32164 UTE TRIBAL 6-21 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32163 UTE TRIBAL 6-22 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33213 UTE TRIBAL 6-22D-55 14-20-H62-4728
43-013-33187 UTE TRIBAL 6-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32570 UTE TRIBAL 6-24-54 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-32143 UTE TRIBAL 6-25H 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33625 UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33476 UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32892 UTE TRIBAL 6-28D-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33172 UTE TRIBAL 6-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33120 UTE TRIBAL 6-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32783 UTE TRIBAL 6-30-55 14-20-H62-5059
43-013-33325 UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32420 UTE TRIBAL 6-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-32897 UTE TRIBAL 6-32D-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32872 UTE TRIBAL 6-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-34028 UTE TRIBAL 6-35D-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32265 UTE TRIBAL 6-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50409 UTE TRIBAL 7-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-33269 UTE TRIBAL 7-14-55 14-20-H62-5016
43-013-32976 UTE TRIBAL 7-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33130 UTE TRIBAL 7-16-54 14-20-H62-3413
43-013-32863 UTE TRIBAL 7-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-32346 UTE TRIBAL 7-20-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-31281 UTE TRIBAL 7-20R-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-32623 UTE TRIBAL 7-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32761 UTE TRIBAL 7-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33721 UTE TRIBAL 7-22D-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32514 UTE TRIBAL 7-23-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-32991 UTE TRIBAL 7-24-56



43-013-32991 UTE TRIBAL 7-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-33621 UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33477 UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32418 UTE TRIBAL 7-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32166 UTE TRIBAL 7-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33788 UTE TRIBAL 7-28D-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32562 UTE TRIBAL 7-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33715 UTE TRIBAL 7-29D-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32167 UTE TRIBAL 7-30 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32528 UTE TRIBAL 7-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32411 UTE TRIBAL 7-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32413 UTE TRIBAL 7-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-50510 UTE TRIBAL 7-34-55 14-20-H62-5028
43-013-32774 UTE TRIBAL 7-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33048 UTE TRIBAL 7-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32929 UTE TRIBAL 7-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50852 UTE TRIBAL 7I-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-50488 UTE TRIBAL 8-10D-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-33204 UTE TRIBAL 8-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-50477 UTE TRIBAL 8-15D-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-32840 UTE TRIBAL 8-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32864 UTE TRIBAL 8-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-32973 UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-50435 UTE TRIBAL 8-21D-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32590 UTE TRIBAL 8-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33552 UTE TRIBAL 8-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33420 UTE TRIBAL 8-24-55 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-32780 UTE TRIBAL 8-25-54 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32620 UTE TRIBAL 8-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33682 UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33859 UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-34058 UTE TRIBAL 8-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32766 UTE TRIBAL 8-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32694 UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33119 UTE TRIBAL 8-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32746 UTE TRIBAL 8-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32869 UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32673 UTE TRIBAL 8-31-55 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-32870 UTE TRIBAL 8-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32421 UTE TRIBAL 8-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-33089 UTE TRIBAL 8-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-50436 UTE TRIBAL 8-34D-55 14-20-H62-5028
43-013-32267 UTE TRIBAL 8-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32423 UTE TRIBAL 8-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50853 UTE TRIBAL 8L-21D-54 14-20-H62-3141
43-013-33328 UTE TRIBAL 9-13D-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-33796 UTE TRIBAL 9-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32701 UTE TRIBAL 9-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33207 UTE TRIBAL 9-16-54

43-013-32991 UTE TRIBAL 7-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-33621 UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33477 UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32418 UTE TRIBAL 7-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32166 UTE TRIBAL 7-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33788 UTE TRIBAL 7-28D-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32562 UTE TRIBAL 7-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33715 UTE TRIBAL 7-29D-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32167 UTE TRIBAL 7-30 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32528 UTE TRIBAL 7-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32411 UTE TRIBAL 7-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32413 UTE TRIBAL 7-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-50510 UTE TRIBAL 7-34-55 14-20-H62-5028
43-013-32774 UTE TRIBAL 7-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33048 UTE TRIBAL 7-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32929 UTE TRIBAL 7-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50852 UTE TRIBAL 7I-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-50488 UTE TRIBAL 8-10D-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-33204 UTE TRIBAL 8-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-50477 UTE TRIBAL 8-15D-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-32840 UTE TRIBAL 8-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32864 UTE TRIBAL 8-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-32973 UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-50435 UTE TRIBAL 8-21D-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32590 UTE TRIBAL 8-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33552 UTE TRIBAL 8-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33420 UTE TRIBAL 8-24-55 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-32780 UTE TRIBAL 8-25-54 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32620 UTE TRIBAL 8-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33682 UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33859 UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-34058 UTE TRIBAL 8-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32766 UTE TRIBAL 8-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32694 UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33119 UTE TRIBAL 8-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32746 UTE TRIBAL 8-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32869 UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32673 UTE TRIBAL 8-31-55 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-32870 UTE TRIBAL 8-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32421 UTE TRIBAL 8-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-33089 UTE TRIBAL 8-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-50436 UTE TRIBAL 8-34D-55 14-20-H62-5028
43-013-32267 UTE TRIBAL 8-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32423 UTE TRIBAL 8-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50853 UTE TRIBAL 8L-21D-54 14-20-H62-3141
43-013-33328 UTE TRIBAL 9-13D-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-33796 UTE TRIBAL 9-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32701 UTE TRIBAL 9-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33207 UTE TRIBAL 9-16-54

43-013-32991 UTE TRIBAL 7-25-56 14-20-H62-5065
43-013-33621 UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33477 UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32418 UTE TRIBAL 7-27-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32166 UTE TRIBAL 7-28 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33788 UTE TRIBAL 7-28D-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32562 UTE TRIBAL 7-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-33715 UTE TRIBAL 7-29D-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32167 UTE TRIBAL 7-30 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32528 UTE TRIBAL 7-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32411 UTE TRIBAL 7-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32413 UTE TRIBAL 7-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-50510 UTE TRIBAL 7-34-55 14-20-H62-5028
43-013-32774 UTE TRIBAL 7-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33048 UTE TRIBAL 7-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32929 UTE TRIBAL 7-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50852 UTE TRIBAL 7I-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-50488 UTE TRIBAL 8-10D-54 14-20-H62-5517
43-013-33204 UTE TRIBAL 8-14-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-50477 UTE TRIBAL 8-15D-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-32840 UTE TRIBAL 8-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32864 UTE TRIBAL 8-19-55 14-20-H62-5058
43-013-32973 UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-50435 UTE TRIBAL 8-21D-55 14-20-H62-4825
43-013-32590 UTE TRIBAL 8-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-33552 UTE TRIBAL 8-23D-55 14-20-H62-3443
43-013-33420 UTE TRIBAL 8-24-55 14-20-H62-4716
43-013-32780 UTE TRIBAL 8-25-54 14-20-H62-3440
43-013-32620 UTE TRIBAL 8-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-33682 UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-54 14-20-H62-4954
43-013-33859 UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-34058 UTE TRIBAL 8-27D-55 14-20-H62-4753
43-013-32766 UTE TRIBAL 8-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-32694 UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-33119 UTE TRIBAL 8-29-55 14-20-H62-5020
43-013-32746 UTE TRIBAL 8-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32869 UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-32673 UTE TRIBAL 8-31-55 14-20-H62-5032
43-013-32870 UTE TRIBAL 8-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32421 UTE TRIBAL 8-32-55 14-20-H62-5026
43-013-33089 UTE TRIBAL 8-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-50436 UTE TRIBAL 8-34D-55 14-20-H62-5028
43-013-32267 UTE TRIBAL 8-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-32423 UTE TRIBAL 8-36-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-50853 UTE TRIBAL 8L-21D-54 14-20-H62-3141
43-013-33328 UTE TRIBAL 9-13D-55 14-20-H62-4845
43-013-33796 UTE TRIBAL 9-14D-54 14-20-H62-5033
43-013-32701 UTE TRIBAL 9-15-55 14-20-H62-5017
43-013-33207 UTE TRIBAL 9-16-54



43-013-32687 UTE TRIBAL 9-17-54 14-20-H62-4731
43-013-32144 UTE TRIBAL 9-18 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-31831 UTE TRIBAL 9-19 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-32379 UTE TRIBAL 9-20-54 14-20-H62-3529
43-013-33675 UTE TRIBAL 9-20D-55 14-20-H62-5018
43-013-33040 UTE TRIBAL 9-21-54 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-32889 UTE TRIBAL 9-22-54 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-32606 UTE TRIBAL 9-22-55 14-20-H62-4754
43-013-32268 UTE TRIBAL 9-24-55 14-20-H62-4749
43-013-32390 UTE TRIBAL 9-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32191 UTE TRIBAL 9-26 14-20-H62-4728
43-013-33359 UTE TRIBAL 9-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
43-013-32388 UTE TRIBAL 9-28-54 14-20-H62-4740
43-013-33787 UTE TRIBAL 9-28D-55 14-20-H62-5019
43-013-32566 UTE TRIBAL 9-29-54 14-20-H62-5036
43-013-32383 UTE TRIBAL 9-30-54 14-20-H62-4662
43-013-32529 UTE TRIBAL 9-31-54 14-20-H62-4946
43-013-33508 UTE TRIBAL 9-31-55 14-20-H62-5060
43-013-32538 UTE TRIBAL 9-32-54 14-20-H62-4947
43-013-32549 UTE TRIBAL 9-33-54 14-20-H62-4948
43-013-32781 UTE TRIBAL 9-35-54 14-20-H62-5053
43-013-33047 UTE TRIBAL 9-35-55 14-20-H62-4945
43-013-33239 UTE TRIBAL 9-36D-55 14-20-H62-4944
43-013-33276 UTE TRIBAL 9S-19-54 14-20-H62-3528
43-013-33245 UTE TRIBAL 9S-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-50997 Vieira Tribal 4-4-54 14-20-H62-5659
43-013-33122 WILCOX ELIASON 7-15-56 FEE
43-013-33150 WILCOX FEE 1-20-56 FEE
43-013-33151 WILCOX FEE 15-16-56 FEE
43-013-32550 WILLIAMSON TRIBAL 3-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-32551 WILLIAMSON TRIBAL 5-34-54 14-20-H62-4955
43-013-31311 Z and T UTE TRIBAL 12-22 14-20-H62-3415
43-013-31280 Z and T UTE TRIBAL 2-21 14-20-H62-3414
43-013-31282 Z and T UTE TRIBAL 7-19 14-20-H62-4919
43-013-31310 Z and T UTE TRIBAL 7-25
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43-013-32390 UTE TRIBAL 9-25-55 14-20-H62-3537
43-013-32191 UTE TRIBAL 9-26 14-20-H62-4728
43-013-33359 UTE TRIBAL 9-26D-55 14-20-H62-3444
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Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED

(April 2004) OMB No. 1004-0137

UNITED STATES Expires March 31, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 14-20-H62-5517

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER 6. Iflndian,AlloteeorTribeName

UTE
7. Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

1a. TYPE OF WORK DRILL REENTER
N/A

8. Lease Name and Well No.

Ab. Type of Well: Oli well Gas weß Other Single zone Multiple zone STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54
2. Nameof0per o0RRY

PETROLEUM COMPANY
3a. Address 4000 SOUTH 4028 WEST 3b. Phone No. (include are code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

RT. 2 BOX 7735, ROOSEVELT, UT. 84066 | (435) 722-1325 BRUNDAGE
4. Location of Well (Report location clearlyandin accordance withany State requirernents.*) NAD 27 11. Sec., T. R. M. or BLK. and Survey or Area

Atsurface SE/SE 474' FSL, 658' FEL 40.055247 LAT SEC. 10, T.5S., R.4W.
Atproposedprod.zone SAME AS ABOVE 110.314061 LONG U.S.B.&M.

14. Distance in miles and dircetion from nearest townor post office* 12. County or Parrish 13. State

20.0 MILES FROM MYTON, UTAH DUCHESNE UTAH
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No, of acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well

'p°r°oapLonytDo eaasi,
e.,,. 474' 640 40

(Also to neaset ong. Unit line, it any)
18. Distance from proposed* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIABond No. on file

'appneeaestr oe ,th lenasecomplete 5,000' 6,046' UTBOOOO35/ RLBOOO5750
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GR, etc.) 22. Approximate date work willstart* 23. Estimated duration

6067' GR REFER TO BPC SOP PLAN REFER TO BPC SOP PLAN

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan. item 20 above.

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lnads, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as maybe required by the
authorized officer.

2T eSignature Name(PrideS-H
LEY E. CROZIER

Date

01/22/10

REG LATORY ERMITTING SPECIALIST
Approved by (Sign rue) Nam (Printed/TypecÛ DateJames H. Sparger m12 2010
Title Office VERNALFIELDOFFICE
App cation approvaldoes not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable titleto those rights in the subject lease which wouldentitle the allicant to
conduct operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTACHED
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crimefor any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter withinits jurisdiction.

*(Instructions on page 2)

NOS "'°9
NOTICEOFAPPROVAL

DIVOFOIL,GAS&
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UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
' BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

• • VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
' 170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: Berry Petroleum Company Location: SESE, Sec. 10, T5S, R4W
Well No: State Tribal 16-10-54 Lease No: 14-20-H62-5517
API No: 43-013-50245 Agreement: N/A

OFFICE NUMBER: (435) 781-4400

OFFICE FAX NUMBER: (435) 781-3420

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease andlor unit operations are to be conducted in such a rnanner that full compliance is made with the
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill including
Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion
operations. This permit is approved for a two (2) year period, or until lease expiration, whichever occurs
first. An additional extension, up to two (2) years, may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Construction Activity - The Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Dept. and BLM Environmental
(Notify Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Scientist shall be notified at least 48 hours in advance of any
Dept. and BLM Environmental construction activity. The Ute Tribal office is open Monday

Scientist) throughThursday.

Construction Completion - Upon completion of the pertinent APDIROW construction, notify
(Notify Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals the Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Dept. for a Tribal Technician to
Dept. and BLM Environmental verifythe Affidavit of Completion. Notify the BLM Environmental

Scientist) Scientist prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notify BLM Petroleum Engineer)

Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to runningcasing and cementing
(Notify BLM Supv. Petroleum Tech.) all casing strings to: ut vn opreport@blm.qov.

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
(Notify BLM Supv. Petroleum Tech.)

First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify BLM Petroleum Engineer) production resumes after well has been off production for more

than ninety (90)
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SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL (COAs)

• Reclamation seed mix as prescribed by the Utah Divisionof Wildlife Resources will be utilized.

• Paint all production facilities and equipment, not otherwise regulated (OSHA, etc.), Shadow
Gray.

• All areas of disturbance (including surface pipelines) must have appropriate surface use
agreements or approvals in place with the proper owner and/or agency before such action is
started.

• The conditions as set forth by those owners and/or
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DOWNHOLE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE COAs:

• Berry Petroleum Co. shall adhere to all referenced requirements in the SOP (version: December
7, 2009) ) along with all Oil and Gas rules and requirements listed in the Code of Federal
Regulations and all Federal Onshore Oil and Gas Orders.

AII provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

DRILLINGICOMPLETIONIPRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

• The spud date and timeshall be reported orallyto Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding.

• Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Enqineering Technician at least 24 hours in
advance of casinq cementinq operations and BOPE & casing pressure tests.

• All requirements listed in Onshore Order #2 Ill. E. Special Drilling Operations are applicable for
air drilling of surface hole.

• Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use untilthe well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times.
Choke manifolds shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

• AIIBOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the
daily drillingreport. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil &
Gas Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical workingorder. All BOPE pressure tests shall be
performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and i by the rig pumps. Test shall be
reported in the driller's log.

• BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from
under the surface casing and weekly thereafteras specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

• Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and
cemented in place.

• No aggressive/fresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

• Cement baskets shall not be run on surface casing.

• The operator must report all shows of water or water-bearing sands to the BLM. Ifflowing water
is encountered it must be sampled, analyzed, and a copy of the analyses submitted to the BLM
Vernal Field Office.

• The operator must report encounters of all non oil& gas mineral resources (such as Gilsonite,
tar sands, oilshale, trona, etc.) to the Vernal Field Office, in writing, within 5 workingdays of
each encounter. Each report shall include the well namelnumber, well location, date and depth
(from KB or GL) of encounter, vertical footage of the encounter and, the name of the
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making the report (along with a telephone number) should the BLM need to obtain additional
information.

• A complete set of angular deviation and directional surveys of a directional well will be
submitted to the Vernal BLM office engineer within30 days of the completion of the well.

• While actively drilling, chronologic drillingprogress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM,
Vernal Field Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum
Engineers until the well is completed.

• A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the top of cement and
shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of
the CBL to this office.

• Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

• There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Any changes in operation
must have prior approval from the BLMVernal Field
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OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

• All wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in
accordance with43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

• In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "Monthly Report of
Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which
operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and
abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management
Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-
3650 for reporting information.

• Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLMVernal Field office must be
notified when it is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be by written
communication and must be received in this office by not later than the fifth business day
following the date on which the well is placed on production. The notificationshall provide, as a
minimum, the following informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephone number.

o Well name and number.

o Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royaltywill
be paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise
the non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will
be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A, shall be
reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than Major
Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on the
Monthly Report of Operations and Production.

• Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days
after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys
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data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be
filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well completion report a geologic report including,
at a minimum,formation tops, and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys,
sample descriptions, strip logs, core data, drillstem test data, and results of production tests if
performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the
BLM, Vernal Field Office.

• All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or comminglingon-lease or off-lease, shall have
prior written approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The BLMVernal Field
Office Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and timefor the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be
submitted to the BLMVernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the API
standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement. All
measurement points shall be identified as the point of sale or allocation for royalty purposes.

• A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted
to the BLMVernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs
first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively
sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3.

• Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filing of
a suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLMVernal Field Office. Emergency approval
may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

• No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the BLMVernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30
days, prior approval of the BLMVernal Field Office shall be obtained and notificationgiven
before resumption of operations.

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but
no later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not
been approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-day period willbe considered as an Incident
of Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order untilan acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this office.

• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or
abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent
Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual
plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of
casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface
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to the BLMVernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs
first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively
sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3.

• Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filing of
a suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLMVernal Field Office. Emergency approval
may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

• No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the BLMVernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30
days, prior approval of the BLMVernal Field Office shall be obtained and notificationgiven
before resumption of operations.

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but
no later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not
been approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-day period willbe considered as an Incident
of Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order untilan acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this office.

• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or
abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent
Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual
plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of
casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface
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data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be
filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well completion report a geologic report including,
at a minimum,formation tops, and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys,
sample descriptions, strip logs, core data, drillstem test data, and results of production tests if
performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the
BLM, Vernal Field Office.

• All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or comminglingon-lease or off-lease, shall have
prior written approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The BLMVernal Field
Office Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and timefor the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be
submitted to the BLMVernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the API
standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement. All
measurement points shall be identified as the point of sale or allocation for royalty purposes.

• A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted
to the BLMVernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs
first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively
sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3.

• Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filing of
a suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLMVernal Field Office. Emergency approval
may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

• No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the BLMVernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30
days, prior approval of the BLMVernal Field Office shall be obtained and notificationgiven
before resumption of operations.

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but
no later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not
been approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-day period willbe considered as an Incident
of Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order untilan acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this office.

• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or
abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent
Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual
plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of
casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface
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STATE OF UTAH FORM6

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY Operator Account Number: N 2480

Address: 4000 S. 4028 W, RT 2 BOX 7735

city ROOSEVELT

state UT ¿¡p 84001 Phone Number: (435) 722-1325

Well i

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4301350245 STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 SESE 10 5S 4W DUCHESNE

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

3/20/2010 g()
Comments:

SPUDDED @APPRX 8:00 AM BY CRAIG'S

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

Well 3

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new we!I (single well only) KATHY K. FIELDSTED
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) Name1Ple e Prin )
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) SR. REG. PERM. TECH 3/22/2010

RECENED Tit'• =•

(5/2000)

MAR2 3 2010

DN.0FOIL,GAS&
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STATE OF UTAH FORM6

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM
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RECENED Tit'• =•

(5/2000)

MAR2 3 2010

DN.0FOIL,GAS&
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STATE OF UTAH FORM6

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING
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D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) SR. REG. PERM. TECH 3/22/2010

RECENED Tit'• =•
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MAR2 3 2010
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O O

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54

Api No: 43-013-50245 Lease Type: INDIAN-STATE SURF

Section 10 Township 05S Range 04W County DUCHESNE

Drilling Contractor CRAIG'S ROUSTABOUT SERV RIG # BUCKET

SPUDDED:
Date 03/20/2010

Time

How DRY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by KATHY K FIELDSTED

Telephone # (435) 722-1325

Date 03/23/2010 Signed

O O

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54

Api No: 43-013-50245 Lease Type: INDIAN-STATE SURF

Section 10 Township 05S Range 04W County DUCHESNE

Drilling Contractor CRAIG'S ROUSTABOUT SERV RIG # BUCKET

SPUDDED:
Date 03/20/2010

Time

How DRY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by KATHY K FIELDSTED

Telephone # (435) 722-1325

Date 03/23/2010 Signed

O O

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: BERRY PETROLEUM COMPANY

Well Name: STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54

Api No: 43-013-50245 Lease Type: INDIAN-STATE SURF

Section 10 Township 05S Range 04W County DUCHESNE

Drilling Contractor CRAIG'S ROUSTABOUT SERV RIG # BUCKET

SPUDDED:
Date 03/20/2010

Time

How DRY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by KATHY K FIELDSTED

Telephone # (435) 722-1325

Date 03/23/2010 Signed



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) 

X Ch - ange 0 fO t (W II Sid) 'pera or e 0 o t N pera or arne Ch ange 1M erger 
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 61112014 

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator): 
Berry Petroelum Company, LLC N4075 Linn Operating, Inc. N4115 
1999 Broadway Street, Suite 3700 1999 Broadway Street, Suite 3700 
Denver, CO 80202 Denver, CO 80202 

Phone: 1 (303)999-4400 Phone: 1 (303) 999-4400 

CANo. Unit: Berry Pilot EOR l46-O2 , 
Brundaae Canyon 

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG 

See Attached List I 

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION 
Enter date after each listed item is completed 

I 

API NO ENTITY 
NO 

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 

LEASE TYPE 

6/1312014 

611312014 

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 9031632-0143 
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: N/A 

5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: Yes 
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 611712014 

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change, 

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM Not Yet 
7. Federal and Indian Units: 

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): 

Not Yet 

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A 

WELL 
TYPE 

BIA 

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved VIC Fonn 5 Transfer of Authority to 

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A 
DATA ENTRY: 
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/18/2014 
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/18/2014 
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/23/2014 
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 612312014 
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: N/A 

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APDlNew on: 6118/2014 
7. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: Yes 

BOND VERIFICATION: 
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: NMBOOO501 
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: NMBOOO501 
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number LPM9149893 

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A 

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION: 
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division 

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/23/2014 
COMMENTS: 

ROUTING 
I CDW 

WELL 
STATUS 

6/1712014 

Not Yet 

Linn Operating, Inc.xls 6f23f2014 

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2014

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
Berry Petroelum Company, LLC N4075 Linn Operating, Inc. N4115
1999 Broadway Street , Suite 3700 1999 Broadway Street, Suite 3700
Denver, CO 80202 Denver, CO 80202

Phone: 1 (303) 999-4400 Phone: 1 (303) 999-4400

CA No. Unit: Berry Pilot EOR 246-02
Brundage Canyon

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/13/2014
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/13/2014
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/17/2014
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 9031632-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: N/A
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: Yes
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/17/2014
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM Not Yet BIA Not Yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: Not Yet
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/18/2014
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/18/2014
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/23/2014
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/23/2014
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: N/A

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 6/18/2014
7. Surfàce Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: Yes
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: NMB000501
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: NMB000501
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number LPM9149893
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of theirresponsibility to notify all interestowners of this change on: 6/23/2014
COMMENTS:

Linn Operating, Inc.xts

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2014

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
Berry Petroelum Company, LLC N4075 Linn Operating, Inc. N4115
1999 Broadway Street , Suite 3700 1999 Broadway Street, Suite 3700
Denver, CO 80202 Denver, CO 80202

Phone: 1 (303) 999-4400 Phone: 1 (303) 999-4400

CA No. Unit: Berry Pilot EOR 246-02
Brundage Canyon

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/13/2014
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/13/2014
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/17/2014
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 9031632-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: N/A
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: Yes
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/17/2014
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM Not Yet BIA Not Yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: Not Yet
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/18/2014
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/18/2014
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/23/2014
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/23/2014
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: N/A

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 6/18/2014
7. Surfàce Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: Yes
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: NMB000501
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: NMB000501
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number LPM9149893
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of theirresponsibility to notify all interestowners of this change on: 6/23/2014
COMMENTS:

Linn Operating, Inc.xts

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2014

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
Berry Petroelum Company, LLC N4075 Linn Operating, Inc. N4115
1999 Broadway Street , Suite 3700 1999 Broadway Street, Suite 3700
Denver, CO 80202 Denver, CO 80202

Phone: 1 (303) 999-4400 Phone: 1 (303) 999-4400

CA No. Unit: Berry Pilot EOR 246-02
Brundage Canyon

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/13/2014
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/13/2014
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/17/2014
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 9031632-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: N/A
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: Yes
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/17/2014
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM Not Yet BIA Not Yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: Not Yet
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/18/2014
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/18/2014
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/23/2014
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/23/2014
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: N/A

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 6/18/2014
7. Surfàce Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: Yes
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: NMB000501
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: NMB000501
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number LPM9149893
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of theirresponsibility to notify all interestowners of this change on: 6/23/2014
COMMENTS:

Linn Operating, Inc.xts



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significanUy deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drill hOrizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OIL WELL ILl GAS WELL 0 OTHER ______________________ ___ 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Linn Operating, Inc. 

STATE CO ZIp80202 

I PHONE NUMBER: 

1(303) 999-4400 

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

1999 Broadway, Ste 3700 CITY Denver 

4. LOCATION OF WELL 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 

QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: 

See attached list 
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

9. API NUMBER: 

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: 

COUNTY: 

STATE: 

UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

III 0 ACIDIZE 0 DEEPEN 0 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(Submit in Duplicate) 0 ALTER CASING 0 FRACTURE TREAT 0 SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work will start: 0 CASING REPAIR 0 NEW CONSTRUCTION 0 TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

0 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS 0 OPERATOR CHANGE 0 TUBING REPAIR 

0 CHANGE TUBING 0 PLUG AND ABANDON 0 VENT OR FLARE 

0 SUBSEQUENT REPORT 0 CHANGE WELL NAME 0 PLUG BACK 0 WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

0 CHANGE WELL STATUS 0 PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) 0 WATER SHUT -OFF 
Date of work completion: 

0 COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS 0 RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE III OTHER: Change of operator 

0 CONVERT WELL TYPE 0 RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

Notice of Change of Operator from Berry Petroleum Company, LLC to Linn Operating, Inc., effective June 1,2014. On 
December 16, 2013, Berry Petroleum Company became an indirect subsidiary of Linn Energy, LLC. As a result, Berry 
Petroleum Company converted into a limited liability company named, "Berry Petroleum Company, LLC". On March 5, 2014, 

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC authorized and empowered Linn Operating, Inc. to act as operator on its behalf. I have 
attached a copy of the original declaration amending the name change along with a copy of the agency agreement and power 
of attorney for the operator change. 

TITLE 

DATE 

(This space for State use only) 

(512000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

Rt:.C'cIVED 

JUN 1 .~ 20\4 

Oiv. of Oil, Gas & Mining 

Sr Engineering Technician 

6/1/2014 

JUN 1 8 201~ 
DIV. OIL GAS & MINING .; 

B~ f2.b Q Q.. m p clc.f\C\.. 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

See attached list
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

Linn Operating, Inc.
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1999 Broadway, Ste 3700
crrY Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 999-4400

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Change of operator
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Notice of Change of Operator from Berry Petroleum Company, LLCto Linn Operating, Inc., effective June 1, 2014. On
December 16, 2013, Berry Petroleum Company became an indirect subsidiary of Linn Energy, LLC. As a result, Berry
Petroleum Company converted into a limited liability company named, "Berry Petroleum Company, LLC". On March 5, 2014,
Berry Petroleum Company, LLCauthorized and empowered Linn Operating, Inc. to act as operator on its behalf. I have
attached a copy of the original declaration amending the name change along with a copy of the agency agreement and power
of attorney for the operator change.

RECENED

JUN1 20½

Div.ofOil,Gas &Mining

NAME(PLEASEPRINT verly Decker TITLE Sr Engineering Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 6/1/2014

(This space for State use only) APP iiGÆ D
JUN18 20#

DIV.OiL GAS &MINING
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

See attached list
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

Linn Operating, Inc.
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1999 Broadway, Ste 3700
crrY Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 999-4400

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Change of operator
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Notice of Change of Operator from Berry Petroleum Company, LLCto Linn Operating, Inc., effective June 1, 2014. On
December 16, 2013, Berry Petroleum Company became an indirect subsidiary of Linn Energy, LLC. As a result, Berry
Petroleum Company converted into a limited liability company named, "Berry Petroleum Company, LLC". On March 5, 2014,
Berry Petroleum Company, LLCauthorized and empowered Linn Operating, Inc. to act as operator on its behalf. I have
attached a copy of the original declaration amending the name change along with a copy of the agency agreement and power
of attorney for the operator change.

RECENED

JUN1 20½

Div.ofOil,Gas &Mining

NAME(PLEASEPRINT verly Decker TITLE Sr Engineering Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 6/1/2014

(This space for State use only) APP iiGÆ D
JUN18 20#

DIV.OiL GAS &MINING
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

See attached list
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

Linn Operating, Inc.
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1999 Broadway, Ste 3700
crrY Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 999-4400

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Change of operator
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Notice of Change of Operator from Berry Petroleum Company, LLCto Linn Operating, Inc., effective June 1, 2014. On
December 16, 2013, Berry Petroleum Company became an indirect subsidiary of Linn Energy, LLC. As a result, Berry
Petroleum Company converted into a limited liability company named, "Berry Petroleum Company, LLC". On March 5, 2014,
Berry Petroleum Company, LLCauthorized and empowered Linn Operating, Inc. to act as operator on its behalf. I have
attached a copy of the original declaration amending the name change along with a copy of the agency agreement and power
of attorney for the operator change.

RECENED

JUN1 20½

Div.ofOil,Gas &Mining

NAME(PLEASEPRINT verly Decker TITLE Sr Engineering Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 6/1/2014

(This space for State use only) APP iiGÆ D
JUN18 20#

DIV.OiL GAS &MINING
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse



STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drill hOrizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OIL WELL I£J 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

1999 Broadway, Ste 3700 CITY Denver 

4. LOCATION OF WELL 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 

GAS WELL 0 OTHER ______________________ ___ 

STATE CO ZIP 80202 

OTR/OTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: 

FORM 9 

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

See attached list 
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

9. API NUMBER: 

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: 

COUNTY: 

STATE: 

UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

121 0 ACIDIZE 0 DEEPEN 0 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(Submit in Duplicate) 0 ALTER CASING 0 FRACTURE TREAT 0 SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work will start: 0 CASING REPAIR 0 NEW CONSTRUCTION 0 TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

0 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS 0 OPERATOR CHANGE 0 TUBING REPAIR 

0 CHANGE TUBING 0 PLUG AND ABANDON 0 VENT OR FLARE 

0 SUBSEQUENT REPORT 0 CHANGE WELL NAME 0 PLUG BACK 0 WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

0 CHANGE WELL STATUS 0 PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) 0 WATER SHUT -OFF 
Date of work completion: 

0 COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS 0 RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE III OTHER: Change of operator 

0 CONVERT WELL TYPE 0 RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

On December 16th, 2013 Berry Petroleum Company and Linn Energy merged. As a result of this merger the companies name 
has changed to "Berry Petroleum Company, LLC". On March 5th, 2014 Berry Petroleum Company, LLC agreed that Linn 
Operating, Inc would become the operator of record effective June 1, 2014. I have attached a copy of the original declaration 
amending the name change along with a copy of the agency agreement and power of attorney for the operator change. 

Should you have any questions please don't hesitate to contact me. 

Beverly Decker 
TITLE 

SIGNATURE ~-"'&.J'-"IIIC~+---'"-=::.....:::....lo.~....::!~'---------- DATE 

(This space for State use only) 

(512000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

RECEIVED 
JUN 1 _ 20\4 

O· 0' ("\;\ ~ ~s & MininfJ \'1. I ..... I • ....,~ . 

Sr Engineering Technician 

611/2014 

JUN 18 2014 
~I~ OIL GAS & MINING, . 

BY:~ch pO f'f¥d Q ~ 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

See attached list

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMlT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER
8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1999 Broadway, Ste 3700 CffY

Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 999-4400
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of operator
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

On December 16th, 2013 Berry Petroleum Company and Linn Energy merged. As a result of this merger the companies name
has changed to "Berry Petroleum Company, LLC". On March 5th, 2014 Berry Petroleum Company, LLC agreed that Linn
Operating, Inc would become the operator of record effective June 1, 2014. I have attached a copy of the original declaration
amending the name change along with a copy of the agency agreement and power of attorney for the operator change.

Should you have any questions please don't hesitate to contact me.

RECEIVED

JUN1 20B

Div.ofCB,Gas &Mining

NAME(PLEASEPRI Beverly Decker TITLE Sr Engineering Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 6/1/2014

(This space for State use only) A WH \WE D
JUN18 20# ·'

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
IV.OiL GAS &

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

See attached list

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMlT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER
8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1999 Broadway, Ste 3700 CffY

Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 999-4400
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of operator
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

On December 16th, 2013 Berry Petroleum Company and Linn Energy merged. As a result of this merger the companies name
has changed to "Berry Petroleum Company, LLC". On March 5th, 2014 Berry Petroleum Company, LLC agreed that Linn
Operating, Inc would become the operator of record effective June 1, 2014. I have attached a copy of the original declaration
amending the name change along with a copy of the agency agreement and power of attorney for the operator change.

Should you have any questions please don't hesitate to contact me.

RECEIVED

JUN1 20B

Div.ofCB,Gas &Mining

NAME(PLEASEPRI Beverly Decker TITLE Sr Engineering Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 6/1/2014

(This space for State use only) A WH \WE D
JUN18 20# ·'

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
IV.OiL GAS &

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

See attached list

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMlT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER
8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1999 Broadway, Ste 3700 CffY

Denver STATE CO ZIP 80202 (303) 999-4400
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of operator
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

On December 16th, 2013 Berry Petroleum Company and Linn Energy merged. As a result of this merger the companies name
has changed to "Berry Petroleum Company, LLC". On March 5th, 2014 Berry Petroleum Company, LLC agreed that Linn
Operating, Inc would become the operator of record effective June 1, 2014. I have attached a copy of the original declaration
amending the name change along with a copy of the agency agreement and power of attorney for the operator change.

Should you have any questions please don't hesitate to contact me.

RECEIVED

JUN1 20B

Div.ofCB,Gas &Mining

NAME(PLEASEPRI Beverly Decker TITLE Sr Engineering Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 6/1/2014

(This space for State use only) A WH \WE D
JUN18 20# ·'

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
IV.OiL GAS &



STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill 

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer) 

Well name: See Attached 

API number: 

Location: Qtr-Qtr: Section Township 

Company that filed original application: Berry Petroleum Company LLC 

Date original permit was issued: 

Company that permit was Issued to: Linn Operating, Inc 

Check Desired Action: one 

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator 

Range: 

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as 
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new 
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application . 

./ Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator 

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the 
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require 
revision. 

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes 

If located on private land, has the ownership changed? n If so, has the surface agreement been updated? 

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting 
requirements for this location? 

Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this 
proposed well? 

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the 
proposed location? 

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? 

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in 
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation? 

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. LPM9149893 .f 

No 

./ 

.f 

.f 

./ 

.f 

.f 

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drill that is being transferred, 
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with 
necessary supporting information as required. 

Title Sr Engineering Technician 

Dam __________________________________ __ 

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for 
Pennit to Drill. 

(312004) 

STATEOF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: See Attached

API number:
Location: Qtr-Qtr: Section Township Range:

Company that filed original application: Berry Petroleum Company LLC

Date original permit was issued:
Company that permit was Issued to: Unn operating,Inc

Check Desired Action:

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

/ Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator
The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes No

If located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated7
Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?
Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?
Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?
Is bonding still in place, which covers thisproposed well? Bond No. LPM9149893

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drillthat is being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (plea nt) Bevedy Decker T¡tje Sr EngineeringTechnician

Signature ///// 6 / { A Date
Representing (companyifame) Berry Petroleum Company LLCand Linn Operating, Inc

The person signing thisform must have legal authorityto represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Applicationfor
PermittoDrill.

STATEOF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: See Attached

API number:
Location: Qtr-Qtr: Section Township Range:

Company that filed original application: Berry Petroleum Company LLC

Date original permit was issued:
Company that permit was Issued to: Unn operating,Inc

Check Desired Action:

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

/ Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator
The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes No

If located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated7
Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?
Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?
Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?
Is bonding still in place, which covers thisproposed well? Bond No. LPM9149893

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drillthat is being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (plea nt) Bevedy Decker T¡tje Sr EngineeringTechnician

Signature ///// 6 / { A Date
Representing (companyifame) Berry Petroleum Company LLCand Linn Operating, Inc

The person signing thisform must have legal authorityto represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Applicationfor
PermittoDrill.

STATEOF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: See Attached

API number:
Location: Qtr-Qtr: Section Township Range:

Company that filed original application: Berry Petroleum Company LLC

Date original permit was issued:

Company that permit was Issued to: Unn operating,Inc

Check Desired Action:

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

/ Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator
The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes No

If located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated7
Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?
Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?
Is bonding still in place, which covers thisproposed well? Bond No. LPM9149893

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drillthat is being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (plea nt) Bevedy Decker T¡tje Sr EngineeringTechnician

Signature ///// 6 / { A Date
Representing (companyifame) Berry Petroleum Company LLCand Linn Operating, Inc

The person signing thisform must have legal authorityto represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Applicationfor
PermittoDrill.



STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill 

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice. Form g. requesting APD transfer) 

Well name: See Attached 

API number: 

Location: Qtr-Otr: Section Township 

Company that filed original application: Berry Petroleum Company LLC 

Date original permit was issued: 

Company that permit was issued to: Linn Operating. Inc 

Cheek Desired Action: one 

.f Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator 

Range: 

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies that the information as 
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new 
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application. 

Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator 

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the 
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require 
revision. 

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes 

If located on private land, has the ownership changed? n If so, has the surface agreement be~n updated? 

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting 
requirements for this location? 

Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this 
proposed well? 

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way. which could affect the 
proposed location? 

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? 

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in 
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation? 

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. LPM9149893 .; 

No 

.f 

.; 

.; 

.f 

.; 

.f 

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drill that is being transferred, 
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with 
necessary supporting information as required. 

Title Sr Engineering Technician 

Dare __________________________________ __ 

arne) Berry Petroleum Company LLC and Linn Opereting. Inc 

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for 
Permit to Drill. 

(3/2004) 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL,GASAND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This formshould accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: See Attached

API number:
Location: Qtr-Qtr: Section Township Range:

Company that filed original application: Berry Petroleum Company LLC

Date original permit was issued:
Company that permit was issued to: Linn Operating, Inc

Chneck Desired Action:

/ Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator
The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies thatthe information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill,remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies thatthe
information as submitted in the previously approved applicationto drill,remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes No

if located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated?
Have any wells been drilledin thevicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting /
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged?
Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?
Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed welI7 Bond No. LPM9149893

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Applicationfor Permit to Drillthat is being transferred,
should be filedon a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Applicationfor Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (pleas nt) Beverly Decker Title Sr EngineeringTechnician

Signature Date
Represe ng (compan ame) Berry Petroleum Company LLC and Linn Operating, Inc

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for
PermittoDrill.

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL,GASAND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This formshould accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: See Attached

API number:
Location: Qtr-Qtr: Section Township Range:

Company that filed original application: Berry Petroleum Company LLC

Date original permit was issued:
Company that permit was issued to: Linn Operating, Inc

Chneck Desired Action:

/ Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator
The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies thatthe information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill,remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies thatthe
information as submitted in the previously approved applicationto drill,remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes No

if located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated?
Have any wells been drilledin thevicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting /
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged?
Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?
Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed welI7 Bond No. LPM9149893

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Applicationfor Permit to Drillthat is being transferred,
should be filedon a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Applicationfor Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (pleas nt) Beverly Decker Title Sr EngineeringTechnician

Signature Date
Represe ng (compan ame) Berry Petroleum Company LLC and Linn Operating, Inc

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for
PermittoDrill.

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL,GASAND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This formshould accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: See Attached

API number:
Location: Qtr-Qtr: Section Township Range:

Company that filed original application: Berry Petroleum Company LLC

Date original permit was issued:

Company that permit was issued to: Linn Operating, Inc

Chneck Desired Action:

/ Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator
The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property, hereby verifies thatthe information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill,remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, hereby verifies thatthe
information as submitted in the previously approved applicationto drill,remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes No

if located on private land, has the ownership changed?

If so, has the surface agreement been updated?
Have any wells been drilledin thevicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting /
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged?
Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?
Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed welI7 Bond No. LPM9149893

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Applicationfor Permit to Drillthat is being transferred,
should be filedon a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Applicationfor Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

Name (pleas nt) Beverly Decker Title Sr EngineeringTechnician

Signature Date
Represe ng (compan ame) Berry Petroleum Company LLC and Linn Operating, Inc

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for
PermittoDrill.
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115) 
Effective June 1, 2014 
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------- -------

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Number Entity Mineral Lease Well Type Well Status Unit
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 2-21 21 050S 040W 4301331280 11130 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 12-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332747 14747 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 14-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332748 14778 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 10-30D-54 30 OSOS 040W 4301332893 15246 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 6-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332975 15300 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 1-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333388 15937 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 13-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301333550 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 11-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301333596 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-17D-55 17 050S 050W 43013336D Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333623 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 14-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301334283 India OW APD
FEDERAL 10-10D-65 10 060S 050W 4301350523 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAI 3-23D-56 23 050S 060W 4301350624 Indian OW APD
FEDERAL 2-lD-64 1 060S 040W 4301350765 Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 7-lD-64 1 060S 040W 4301350766 Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 9-lD-64 1 060S 040W 4301350767 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-28D-56 28 050S 060W 4301350865 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-9-56 10 05% 060W 4301350874 Indian OW APD
CC FEE 8-24-38 24 030S 080W 4301350885 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4H-26-56 26 050S 060W 4301350951 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 4H-12-57 12 050S 070W 4301350952 Fee OW APD
CC TRIBAL 4-2-48 2 040S 080W 4301350964 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5H-34-45 34 040S 050W 4301350974 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 11-34-45 _ 34 040S 050W 4301350975 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-2D-56 2 050S 060W 4301350988 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 10-18D-56 18 050S 060W 4301350989 Indian OW APD
CC TRIBAL 4-30D-38 19 030S 080W 4301350993 Indian OW APD
FEDERAL 4-1-65 1 060S 050W 4301351016 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301351032 Indian OW APD
CC FEE 6-21-38 21 030S 080W 4301351059 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-28-45 28 040S 050W 4301351061 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5H-23-45 23 0405 050W 4301351071 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4H-27-45 27 040S 050W 4301351072 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 16-27-45 27 040S 050W 4301351074 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12-27-45 27 040S 050W 4301351075 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 16-23-45 040S 4301351077 ÒW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-30-56 30 050S 060W 4301351133 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-29D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351184 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-19-56 19 050S 060W 4301351193 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 15-11D-56 11 050S 060W 4301351197 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-10-56 11 050S 060W 4301351209 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 2-31D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351261 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-24-45 24 040S 050W 4301351273 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301351274 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-16D-55 16 050S 050W 4301351284 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4H-15-55 15 050W 4301351292 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13H-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301351297 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 1-32-55 32 050S 050W 4301351298 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-21D-55 21 OSOS 050W 4301351299 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12-33-45 33 040S 050W 4301351301 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-15D-55 15 050S 050W 4301351302 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 2-24-55 24 050S 050W 4301351304 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL l l-32D-56 32 060W 4301351315 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-32D-56 32 050S 060W 4301351317 Indian OW
LC TRIBAL SH-32-56 32 050S 060W 4301351318 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5H-33-45 33 040S 050W 4301351338 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 14-28-45 28 040S 050W 4301351339 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 16-32D-45 32 040S 050W 301351340 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-31-45 040S 050W 301351347 _ OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-18D-56 18 050S 060W 4301351367 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-18D-56 18 S 060W 4301351368 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 9-23D-56 23 050S 060W 4301351380 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-34D-45 34 OS 050W 4301351382 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12-21D-56 21 OSOS 060W 4301351383 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-29D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351386 Indian OW

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Number Entity Mineral Lease Well Type Well Status Unit
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 2-21 21 050S 040W 4301331280 11130 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 12-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332747 14747 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 14-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332748 14778 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 10-30D-54 30 OSOS 040W 4301332893 15246 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 6-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332975 15300 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 1-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333388 15937 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 13-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301333550 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 11-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301333596 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-17D-55 17 050S 050W 43013336D Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333623 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 14-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301334283 India OW APD
FEDERAL 10-10D-65 10 060S 050W 4301350523 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAI 3-23D-56 23 050S 060W 4301350624 Indian OW APD
FEDERAL 2-lD-64 1 060S 040W 4301350765 Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 7-lD-64 1 060S 040W 4301350766 Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 9-lD-64 1 060S 040W 4301350767 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-28D-56 28 050S 060W 4301350865 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-9-56 10 05% 060W 4301350874 Indian OW APD
CC FEE 8-24-38 24 030S 080W 4301350885 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4H-26-56 26 050S 060W 4301350951 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 4H-12-57 12 050S 070W 4301350952 Fee OW APD
CC TRIBAL 4-2-48 2 040S 080W 4301350964 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5H-34-45 34 040S 050W 4301350974 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 11-34-45 _ 34 040S 050W 4301350975 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-2D-56 2 050S 060W 4301350988 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 10-18D-56 18 050S 060W 4301350989 Indian OW APD
CC TRIBAL 4-30D-38 19 030S 080W 4301350993 Indian OW APD
FEDERAL 4-1-65 1 060S 050W 4301351016 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301351032 Indian OW APD
CC FEE 6-21-38 21 030S 080W 4301351059 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-28-45 28 040S 050W 4301351061 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5H-23-45 23 0405 050W 4301351071 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4H-27-45 27 040S 050W 4301351072 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 16-27-45 27 040S 050W 4301351074 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12-27-45 27 040S 050W 4301351075 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 16-23-45 040S 4301351077 ÒW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-30-56 30 050S 060W 4301351133 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-29D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351184 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-19-56 19 050S 060W 4301351193 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 15-11D-56 11 050S 060W 4301351197 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-10-56 11 050S 060W 4301351209 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 2-31D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351261 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-24-45 24 040S 050W 4301351273 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301351274 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-16D-55 16 050S 050W 4301351284 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4H-15-55 15 050W 4301351292 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13H-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301351297 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 1-32-55 32 050S 050W 4301351298 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-21D-55 21 OSOS 050W 4301351299 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12-33-45 33 040S 050W 4301351301 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-15D-55 15 050S 050W 4301351302 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 2-24-55 24 050S 050W 4301351304 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL l l-32D-56 32 060W 4301351315 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-32D-56 32 050S 060W 4301351317 Indian OW
LC TRIBAL SH-32-56 32 050S 060W 4301351318 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5H-33-45 33 040S 050W 4301351338 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 14-28-45 28 040S 050W 4301351339 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 16-32D-45 32 040S 050W 301351340 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-31-45 040S 050W 301351347 _ OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-18D-56 18 050S 060W 4301351367 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-18D-56 18 S 060W 4301351368 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 9-23D-56 23 050S 060W 4301351380 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-34D-45 34 OS 050W 4301351382 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12-21D-56 21 OSOS 060W 4301351383 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-29D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351386 Indian OW

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Number Entity Mineral Lease Well Type Well Status Unit
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 2-21 21 050S 040W 4301331280 11130 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 12-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332747 14747 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 14-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332748 14778 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 10-30D-54 30 OSOS 040W 4301332893 15246 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 6-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332975 15300 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 1-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333388 15937 Indian WI A BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 13-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301333550 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 11-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301333596 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-17D-55 17 050S 050W 43013336D Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333623 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 14-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301334283 India OW APD
FEDERAL 10-10D-65 10 060S 050W 4301350523 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAI 3-23D-56 23 050S 060W 4301350624 Indian OW APD
FEDERAL 2-lD-64 1 060S 040W 4301350765 Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 7-lD-64 1 060S 040W 4301350766 Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 9-lD-64 1 060S 040W 4301350767 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-28D-56 28 050S 060W 4301350865 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-9-56 10 05% 060W 4301350874 Indian OW APD
CC FEE 8-24-38 24 030S 080W 4301350885 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4H-26-56 26 050S 060W 4301350951 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 4H-12-57 12 050S 070W 4301350952 Fee OW APD
CC TRIBAL 4-2-48 2 040S 080W 4301350964 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5H-34-45 34 040S 050W 4301350974 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 11-34-45 _ 34 040S 050W 4301350975 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-2D-56 2 050S 060W 4301350988 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 10-18D-56 18 050S 060W 4301350989 Indian OW APD
CC TRIBAL 4-30D-38 19 030S 080W 4301350993 Indian OW APD
FEDERAL 4-1-65 1 060S 050W 4301351016 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301351032 Indian OW APD
CC FEE 6-21-38 21 030S 080W 4301351059 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-28-45 28 040S 050W 4301351061 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5H-23-45 23 0405 050W 4301351071 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4H-27-45 27 040S 050W 4301351072 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 16-27-45 27 040S 050W 4301351074 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12-27-45 27 040S 050W 4301351075 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 16-23-45 040S 4301351077 ÒW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-30-56 30 050S 060W 4301351133 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-29D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351184 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-19-56 19 050S 060W 4301351193 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 15-11D-56 11 050S 060W 4301351197 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-10-56 11 050S 060W 4301351209 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 2-31D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351261 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13H-24-45 24 040S 050W 4301351273 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301351274 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-16D-55 16 050S 050W 4301351284 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4H-15-55 15 050W 4301351292 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13H-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301351297 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 1-32-55 32 050S 050W 4301351298 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-21D-55 21 OSOS 050W 4301351299 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12-33-45 33 040S 050W 4301351301 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-15D-55 15 050S 050W 4301351302 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 2-24-55 24 050S 050W 4301351304 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL l l-32D-56 32 060W 4301351315 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-32D-56 32 050S 060W 4301351317 Indian OW
LC TRIBAL SH-32-56 32 050S 060W 4301351318 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5H-33-45 33 040S 050W 4301351338 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 14-28-45 28 040S 050W 4301351339 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 16-32D-45 32 040S 050W 301351340 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-31-45 040S 050W 301351347 _ OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-18D-56 18 050S 060W 4301351367 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-18D-56 18 S 060W 4301351368 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 9-23D-56 23 050S 060W 4301351380 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-34D-45 34 OS 050W 4301351382 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12-21D-56 21 OSOS 060W 4301351383 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-29D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351386 Indian OW
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UTE TRIBAL 6-15-55 _ 15 050S 050W 4301351399 Indian OW Apo+---__________ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 13H-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301351403 ' ~ OW APO I 

LC TRIBAL 6-160-56 16 050S 060W 4301351406--~Innddl~anan----,LowW _~ ~APPOO' .=1_ -==--===----=-
LC TRIBAL 3-140-56 14 050S 060W 4301351408 --t-
CC FEE 13-90-37 9 030S 070W 4301351409 Fee OW APO .=t=. 
CC FEE 16-210-38 21 030S 080W 4301351410 Fee OW APO --------------l 

UTE TRIBAL 5H-IO-54 .~ 050S 040W 4301351415 ' #"""'" OW APD ~ r--------.. ~-
LC TRIBAL 13-60-57 6 050S 070W 4301351417 Indian OW APO __________ _ 
LC TRIBAL 9-23-45 23 040S 050W 4301351432 Indian OW APO ---_ .. 
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LC Tribal 1-130-58 ___ ~ ___ --L!-L-- 050S080W 4301351785 Indian OW ~I-----~----.--
~~~;:~::!~;~~;~7 ._____ 1~2 i~~~~ ~:~: :;~~~~~;:: ' ~::::' g:-~=-+---- --_~--_ 
~f~:::::i~;: ---:---==-=- l I:;:~ ~:~ ::::;;:~: I ::: I~~if- I---=-=-----~~~·--= 
LC TRIBAL 12-310-56 ----=..:.==-___ =_ --=#f- !050S 060W 4301351799 ---~-- lOW -.-_-. APO _+_-==-=~.:.. ____ =-----~~ ___ _ 
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UTE TRIBAL 6-15-55 15 OSOS 050W 4301351399 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13H-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301351403 Indian APD
LC TRIBAL 6-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301351406 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-14D-56 14 050S 060W 430135 Indian OW APD
CC FEE 13-9D-37 9 030S 070W 4301351409 Fee APD
CC FEE 16-21D-38 21 030S 080W 4301351410_ OW APD
UTE TRIBAL SH-10-54 10 050S 040W 4301351415 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13-6D-57 6 050S 070W 4301351417 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-23-45 23 040S 050W 4301351432 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-28D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351441 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 15-20D-56 29 050S 4301351443 OW APD
LC FEE 14-1-56 1 S 060W OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-3D-56 3 050S W 4301351459 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 16-33-45 33 040S 050W 4301351463 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-23D-56 23 050S 060W 4301351479 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4-7-56 50S 060W 4301351482 Indiaan OW
LC TRIBAL 3-2-56 2 OSOS 060W 4301351483 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-23-56 23 050S 060W 4301351488 Indian OW APD
CC TRIBAL 15-34D-38 2 040S 080W 4301351490 Indian OW PD
CC TRIBAL 14-35D-38 2 040S 080W 4301351491 Indian OW APD
CC TRIBAL 8-3D-48 2 040S 080W 4301351493 Indian OW PD
LC TRIBAL 12HH-31-45 3 040S 050W 430N9 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-10D-56 10 050S 060W 4301351510 India OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-10D-56 10 050S 060W 4301351511 Indian OW PD
LC TRIBAL 7-10D-56 10 050S 060W 4301351512 Indian OW PD
LC TRIBAL 9-29D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351513 Indian W APD
UTE TRIBAL 1-16-55 16 050S 050W 4301351519 Indian OW APD
CC Tribal 3-27D-38 27 030S 080W 4301351604 Indian W APD
LC FEE 10-36D-56 36 050S 060W 4301351622 Fee W APD
Myrin Fee 3-16D-55 16 050S 050W 4301351633 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-34-56 34 050S 060W 4301351634 Indian W
UTE FEE 12-16D-55 16 050S 050W 4301351635 Fee W APD
LC TRIBAL 15-27-56 27 050S 060W 4301351649 Indian W
I C TRIBAL 11-27D-56 27 050S 060W W35l650 Indian W APD
LC TRIBAL 1-17-56 17 050S 060W 4301351704 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 13-11D-58 11 OSOS 080W 4301351708 Indian OW D
LC Tribal 15-11D-58 11 050S 080W 301351709 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 4HW-8-56 8 050S 060W 301351710 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 1-11D-56 11 OSOS 060W 4301351712 ee APD
LC TRIBAL 3-11D-56 11 050S 060W 4301351713 Indian APD
LC TRIBAL 7-11D-56 11 OSOS 060W 4301351714 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-34D-45 34 040S 050W 4301351717 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 8M-23-45 23 040S 050W 4301351722 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4-34D-45 34 040S \050W 4301351723 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-34D-45 34 040S 050W 4301351724 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 3-14D-58 11 050S 0WW 4¾l35l726 Indian OW
LC Tribal 11-11D-58 11 050S 080W 4301351729 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 8-31D-56 050S 060W 301351746 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13-34D-45 4 040S 050W 4301351747 Indian OW APD
LC Fee 2-6D-57 050S 070W 4301351749 OW
LC Tribal 15-12D-58 12 OSOS 080W 4301351783 Indian JOW APD
LC Triba19-12D-58 12 050S 080W 4301351784 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 1-13D-58 12 050S 080W 4301351785 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 13-7D-57 12 050S 080W 4301351786 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 9-2D-58 2 050S 080W 4301351788 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 1-2D-58 050S 080W 4 Indian OW_ D
LC Tribal 5-lD-58 2 050S 080W 4301351790 Indian OW_ APD
LC TRIBAL 12-31D-56 31 050S 060W 4301351799 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 8-20D-56 20 050S 060W 4 0 Indian OW
LC TRIBAL 6-31D-56 05 430135 OW APD
LC Tribal 11-7D-57 7 050S 070W Gl351814 Indian OW
LC Tribal 5-7D-57_ __ _ OSOS 070W 430135181 iaan OŸV APD
LC Fee 15-6D-57 6 05 4301351816 e OW APD
LC Tribal 11-6D-57 6 050S 70W 4301351817 ian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-27-56 _ 27 50S 060W 4301351822 OW PD
LC TRIBAL 7-27D-56 27 50S 60W 4301351823 Indian OW PD
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UTE TRIBAL 6-15-55 15 OSOS 050W 4301351399 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13H-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301351403 Indian APD
LC TRIBAL 6-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301351406 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-14D-56 14 050S 060W 430135 Indian OW APD
CC FEE 13-9D-37 9 030S 070W 4301351409 Fee APD
CC FEE 16-21D-38 21 030S 080W 4301351410_ OW APD
UTE TRIBAL SH-10-54 10 050S 040W 4301351415 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13-6D-57 6 050S 070W 4301351417 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-23-45 23 040S 050W 4301351432 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-28D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351441 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 15-20D-56 29 050S 4301351443 OW APD
LC FEE 14-1-56 1 S 060W OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-3D-56 3 050S W 4301351459 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 16-33-45 33 040S 050W 4301351463 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-23D-56 23 050S 060W 4301351479 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4-7-56 50S 060W 4301351482 Indiaan OW
LC TRIBAL 3-2-56 2 OSOS 060W 4301351483 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-23-56 23 050S 060W 4301351488 Indian OW APD
CC TRIBAL 15-34D-38 2 040S 080W 4301351490 Indian OW PD
CC TRIBAL 14-35D-38 2 040S 080W 4301351491 Indian OW APD
CC TRIBAL 8-3D-48 2 040S 080W 4301351493 Indian OW PD
LC TRIBAL 12HH-31-45 3 040S 050W 430N9 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-10D-56 10 050S 060W 4301351510 India OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-10D-56 10 050S 060W 4301351511 Indian OW PD
LC TRIBAL 7-10D-56 10 050S 060W 4301351512 Indian OW PD
LC TRIBAL 9-29D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351513 Indian W APD
UTE TRIBAL 1-16-55 16 050S 050W 4301351519 Indian OW APD
CC Tribal 3-27D-38 27 030S 080W 4301351604 Indian W APD
LC FEE 10-36D-56 36 050S 060W 4301351622 Fee W APD
Myrin Fee 3-16D-55 16 050S 050W 4301351633 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-34-56 34 050S 060W 4301351634 Indian W
UTE FEE 12-16D-55 16 050S 050W 4301351635 Fee W APD
LC TRIBAL 15-27-56 27 050S 060W 4301351649 Indian W
I C TRIBAL 11-27D-56 27 050S 060W W35l650 Indian W APD
LC TRIBAL 1-17-56 17 050S 060W 4301351704 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 13-11D-58 11 OSOS 080W 4301351708 Indian OW D
LC Tribal 15-11D-58 11 050S 080W 301351709 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 4HW-8-56 8 050S 060W 301351710 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 1-11D-56 11 OSOS 060W 4301351712 ee APD
LC TRIBAL 3-11D-56 11 050S 060W 4301351713 Indian APD
LC TRIBAL 7-11D-56 11 OSOS 060W 4301351714 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-34D-45 34 040S 050W 4301351717 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 8M-23-45 23 040S 050W 4301351722 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4-34D-45 34 040S \050W 4301351723 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-34D-45 34 040S 050W 4301351724 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 3-14D-58 11 050S 0WW 4¾l35l726 Indian OW
LC Tribal 11-11D-58 11 050S 080W 4301351729 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 8-31D-56 050S 060W 301351746 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13-34D-45 4 040S 050W 4301351747 Indian OW APD
LC Fee 2-6D-57 050S 070W 4301351749 OW
LC Tribal 15-12D-58 12 OSOS 080W 4301351783 Indian JOW APD
LC Triba19-12D-58 12 050S 080W 4301351784 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 1-13D-58 12 050S 080W 4301351785 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 13-7D-57 12 050S 080W 4301351786 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 9-2D-58 2 050S 080W 4301351788 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 1-2D-58 050S 080W 4 Indian OW_ D
LC Tribal 5-lD-58 2 050S 080W 4301351790 Indian OW_ APD
LC TRIBAL 12-31D-56 31 050S 060W 4301351799 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 8-20D-56 20 050S 060W 4 0 Indian OW
LC TRIBAL 6-31D-56 05 430135 OW APD
LC Tribal 11-7D-57 7 050S 070W Gl351814 Indian OW
LC Tribal 5-7D-57_ __ _ OSOS 070W 430135181 iaan OŸV APD
LC Fee 15-6D-57 6 05 4301351816 e OW APD
LC Tribal 11-6D-57 6 050S 70W 4301351817 ian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-27-56 _ 27 50S 060W 4301351822 OW PD
LC TRIBAL 7-27D-56 27 50S 60W 4301351823 Indian OW PD

Berry Petroleum Company, LLCN4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

UTE TRIBAL 6-15-55 15 OSOS 050W 4301351399 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13H-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301351403 Indian APD
LC TRIBAL 6-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301351406 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-14D-56 14 050S 060W 430135 Indian OW APD
CC FEE 13-9D-37 9 030S 070W 4301351409 Fee APD
CC FEE 16-21D-38 21 030S 080W 4301351410_ OW APD
UTE TRIBAL SH-10-54 10 050S 040W 4301351415 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13-6D-57 6 050S 070W 4301351417 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-23-45 23 040S 050W 4301351432 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-28D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351441 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 15-20D-56 29 050S 4301351443 OW APD
LC FEE 14-1-56 1 S 060W OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-3D-56 3 050S W 4301351459 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 16-33-45 33 040S 050W 4301351463 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-23D-56 23 050S 060W 4301351479 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4-7-56 50S 060W 4301351482 Indiaan OW
LC TRIBAL 3-2-56 2 OSOS 060W 4301351483 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-23-56 23 050S 060W 4301351488 Indian OW APD
CC TRIBAL 15-34D-38 2 040S 080W 4301351490 Indian OW PD
CC TRIBAL 14-35D-38 2 040S 080W 4301351491 Indian OW APD
CC TRIBAL 8-3D-48 2 040S 080W 4301351493 Indian OW PD
LC TRIBAL 12HH-31-45 3 040S 050W 430N9 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-10D-56 10 050S 060W 4301351510 India OW APD
LC TRIBAL 3-10D-56 10 050S 060W 4301351511 Indian OW PD
LC TRIBAL 7-10D-56 10 050S 060W 4301351512 Indian OW PD
LC TRIBAL 9-29D-56 29 050S 060W 4301351513 Indian W APD
UTE TRIBAL 1-16-55 16 050S 050W 4301351519 Indian OW APD
CC Tribal 3-27D-38 27 030S 080W 4301351604 Indian W APD
LC FEE 10-36D-56 36 050S 060W 4301351622 Fee W APD
Myrin Fee 3-16D-55 16 050S 050W 4301351633 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 12H-34-56 34 050S 060W 4301351634 Indian W
UTE FEE 12-16D-55 16 050S 050W 4301351635 Fee W APD
LC TRIBAL 15-27-56 27 050S 060W 4301351649 Indian W
I C TRIBAL 11-27D-56 27 050S 060W W35l650 Indian W APD
LC TRIBAL 1-17-56 17 050S 060W 4301351704 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 13-11D-58 11 OSOS 080W 4301351708 Indian OW D
LC Tribal 15-11D-58 11 050S 080W 301351709 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 4HW-8-56 8 050S 060W 301351710 Indian OW APD
LC FEE 1-11D-56 11 OSOS 060W 4301351712 ee APD
LC TRIBAL 3-11D-56 11 050S 060W 4301351713 Indian APD
LC TRIBAL 7-11D-56 11 OSOS 060W 4301351714 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-34D-45 34 040S 050W 4301351717 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 8M-23-45 23 040S 050W 4301351722 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4-34D-45 34 040S \050W 4301351723 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-34D-45 34 040S 050W 4301351724 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 3-14D-58 11 050S 0WW 4¾l35l726 Indian OW
LC Tribal 11-11D-58 11 050S 080W 4301351729 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 8-31D-56 050S 060W 301351746 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13-34D-45 4 040S 050W 4301351747 Indian OW APD
LC Fee 2-6D-57 050S 070W 4301351749 OW
LC Tribal 15-12D-58 12 OSOS 080W 4301351783 Indian JOW APD
LC Triba19-12D-58 12 050S 080W 4301351784 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 1-13D-58 12 050S 080W 4301351785 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 13-7D-57 12 050S 080W 4301351786 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 9-2D-58 2 050S 080W 4301351788 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 1-2D-58 050S 080W 4 Indian OW_ D
LC Tribal 5-lD-58 2 050S 080W 4301351790 Indian OW_ APD
LC TRIBAL 12-31D-56 31 050S 060W 4301351799 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 8-20D-56 20 050S 060W 4 0 Indian OW
LC TRIBAL 6-31D-56 05 430135 OW APD
LC Tribal 11-7D-57 7 050S 070W Gl351814 Indian OW
LC Tribal 5-7D-57_ __ _ OSOS 070W 430135181 iaan OŸV APD
LC Fee 15-6D-57 6 05 4301351816 e OW APD
LC Tribal 11-6D-57 6 050S 70W 4301351817 ian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-27-56 _ 27 50S 060W 4301351822 OW PD
LC TRIBAL 7-27D-56 27 50S 60W 4301351823 Indian OW PD
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LC Tribal3-27D-45 27 040S 050W 4301351911 , Indian ,OW APD i 

LC TRIBAL 9-341)-56 34 OSOS O6OW 4301351914 !Jndi~ lOW _ APD --l- _________ _ 
CC Fee 8R-9-37 9 030S 070W 4301351937 Fee_ OW _ ,APD 1 _____ _ 

LC Triball0-33D-45 33 040S '050W 4301351939 , Indian ___ OW_ APD ~ ____ .. _____ ~_ 
LC Tribal 14-33D-45 33 040S 050W4301351940 i Indian lOW ~_ I __________ _ 

~~ i~~~ ~~~;~~~:; ----------- ;;:~ ~;~~ :i~:i;:::: i:::;': - I~~ -~ -- -I--=----=-:-..:. 
LC Tribal6-33D-45 ____ ~____ 33 __ 040S 050W 14301351955 i Indian _____ ~~ APD __ _ ____________ _ 

LC Tribal6-32D-45_____ 32 040S 050W 4301351956 Indian OW __ ~_=-:: t,,------.--
FederaI3-11D-65 ---------Jl-- 060S ,050W 4301351982 Federal_OW APD _ . _____ . ____ . ___ _ 
Federal 2-4-64 ==lie 060S 040W 4301351983 I Federal OW _ APD__ _ __________ _ 

~:~::;;~!~~~-----.. --~--+ ~~~~ ~~~: :~~~~;~~:: ,~:~:~:~---~~~~ ~t' -==--=-- -= 
~:~:~:~~~:~~~: ----.. -----4- ::::~,:i~:i;::::. ;:;::: - ~~ I~~ :--==----=-~---- -= 
FOOornl6·41>-64 --:-....:....-_---:-- 1:9 - - 060S 040W 4301351989 _ ~~_ . OW APD _±-' ___ --------------
Federal7-9D-64 ________ 060S 040W 4301351990 _ :Federal r2'!!-- 'APD _ _ ________ _ 
FederaI4-4D-64 14 060S 040W 14301351991 I Federal OW ~-
Federal9-4D-64 -~ -------.~ 4 060S 040W 4301352004 Federal- lOW .~ t=: ---- -- ---=-
FederallO-4D-64 __ =~=-____ ~ ___ 060S ~ 4301352011 Federal:= OW. -IAPD ._. _____ . _____ --=-_ 
FederaI3-9D-64 _____ ~ ___ -Ji-= 060S MOW.430""OlS. F"""'" ~-_ - APD --t-----.---.----

~§ f~ --=-=~+-=-i~!~~l!lll~~~h- '~§ .-I~~ I~~ : --t ~=- -~ -
FOOornl 16·4D·64 _ 4 060S MOW 4301352026 _ IF"""'" ----Ig~ I APD _----t 
;;d~~b~5~~;!~-45 ~:~----- -- f ~~~ '~~~::~:i;;~~ - =, --- ig~~- ~~~ ~=-t -=~-= -=-
FederaI5-9D-64 ____ - __ -=--==- 9 - 060S~:~::~~~~;;~;~ i " _IFederal ___ -_ OW-~-IAPD~'~ __ -==-----=-~ __ _ 
~~~-~=== _____ - : - ::: MOW 430BS2037 -;:;::: I~~ --,~~ -~ -[ --=---:---=- = 
FederaI12-9D-64 ____________ ,9 __ 060S i040W 4301352038 Federal_ o~r_~ ____ , _____________ _ 
Federal 13-9D-64 _______ 19~ 060S 040W 43013520~+- Federal =i=-'OW -'-~±' ---___________ _ 
FEDERAL 14-9D-6_ L ___________ --E--. __ ~OS 040W 43_013520~---:EFede:ral-- OW ---_ rAPD-.--- .___ __ _ ___ __-
FederallO-9D-64 ----------~---fo 060S 040W4301352041 i ____ Fede!.!iL_ OW __ APD__ _ ______________ .. 
FederaI2-9D-64 _____________ ~ __ c<!~OS _ 040W 4301352042 Federal ___ \OW_2PD - - -1 ____ .. ______ _ 
Federal 15-9D-64 . . _9 060S 040W 4301352043 I Federal OW. IAPD 

~~d~~~~~~~~;~~-4:~=-=-==-J, -~:~~ ~:~: :~~~~;;~:: i -~=i:' - I~~ - ~g -i· u ---=-:_n ~ 
LC Tribal 16-28D-45 -- ---= -_=-__ -=~ __ ~OS 050W 43013520731 _Indian-= OW=-IAPD- __ (=~=_==---=-
LCTribalI5-24D-45 _______ ~ 040S ~~01352074 r-- IIndian ____ tOW __ IIAP~ __ + __ ---------- _______ _ 
LCTribal13-17D-56 _________ 117 _ ~0~6~~01352076 _IIndian __ OW _ JMlQ.._I ___________ _ 
LC Tribal 15-17D-56 ____ --IIi. 17 __ 050S 060W 1430135207U iIndian -t§%---- APD __ ~ ______ ~ __ 

~¥r*:~i~~~~~~~6---- -------~ ~;~~ '~~~:;:~~~t---~--i~:--~~- -i- ----- --,,-----
3 

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

LC Fee 7-31D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351857 Fee OW
LC Tribal 5-31D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351858 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 8-33-45 33 040S 050W 301351859 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 16-31-45 040S 050W m351863 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 7-23D-45 23 040S_ 050W 4301351865 Indian OW
LC Tribal 1-23D-56 23 050S 060W 43 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-19-56 19 050S 060W 4301351867 Indian OW APD
ÚCTRIBAL 7-19D-56 19 050S 060W 4301351868 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-4D-56 4 OSOS 060W 4301351869 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 14-32D-45 32 4301351879 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-17D-56 17 _ 05 4301351886 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-17D-56 17 OSOS 060W 4301351887 Indian OW APD
ÜC FEE 4-32D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351892 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-2D-56 2 050S 060W 4301351893 Indian OW APD
ÚC TRIBAL 1-2D-56 050S 060W 4301351894 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 15-23D-45 3 040S 050W 4301351895 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL ll-34D-56 34 0 060W 4301351900 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-5D-56 4 050S 060W 4301351901 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 10-28D-45 28 040S 050W 4301351903 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13-20D-56 0 050S 060W 4301351904 Indian OW APD
Ute Tribal 14-17-55 17 050S 050W 4301351908 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 3-27D-45 27 040S 050W 4301351911 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-34D-56 050S 060W Indian OW APD
ÒC Fee 8R-9-37 9 030S 070W 430135193i Fee OW APD
LC Tribal 10-33D 33 40S 50W 4301351939 Indian D
LC Tribal 14-33D-45 33 040S 050W 4301351940 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal 10-27D-45 27 40S 050W 4301351941 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal 14-27D-45 27 040S 050W 4301351951 Indian OW APD

33 040S 050W 4301351955 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal 6-32D-45 32 040S 050W 4301351956 Indian OW APD
Federal 3-11D-65 11 060S 050W 4 Federal OW APD
Federal 2-4-64 4 4301351983 Federal W APD
Federal 5-11D-65 060S 050W 4301351984 ederal W APD
Federal 7-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301351985 ederal OW APD
Federal 3-4D-64 060S 040W 4301351986 Federal OW APD
Federal 8-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301351988 Federal
Federa16-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301351989 Federal OW APD
Federal 7-9D-64 9 4301351990 eral OW APD
Federal 4-4D-64 4 060S 040 4301351991 ederal OW APD
Federa19-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352004 ederal W APD
Federal 10-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352011 ederal W APD
Federal 3-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352015 ederal W APD
Federal 1-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352020 ederal W APD
Federal 6-9-64 060S 040W 4301352021 Federal OW APD
Federal 8-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352023 Federal W APD
Federal 1-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352 Federal APD
Federal l6-4D-64 4 060S 040W 301352026 Federal OW APD
LC Tribal 10-23D-45 040S 050W 301352029 OW
Federal 15-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352032 Meral OW APD
Federal 5-9D-64 9 060S 040W 43 FederaÏ
Federal 9-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352036 Federal OW APD
Federal 11-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352037 Federal OW APD
Federal 12-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352038 Federal OW Am
Federal 13-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352039 FederaÏ OW APD
FEDERAL 14-9D-64 9 OS 040W 4301352040 Fede OW APD
Federal 10-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352041 Federal OW APD
Federal 2-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352042 Federal OW APD
Federal 15-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352043 Federal OW APD
Federal 16-9D-64 9 060S 040W 301352044 Federal OW APD
LC Tribal 10-32D-45 2 040S 301352065 In an
LC Tribal 16-28D-45 040S 050W 301352073 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 15-24D-45 04 50W 4301352074 OW D
LC Tribal 13-17D-56 17 050S 060W 4301352076 an OW D
LC Tribal 15-17D-56 050S 060W 4301352077 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 5-26D-56 26 050S 060W 01352097 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal ll-26D-56 26 050S 060W 4301352098 Indian OW APD
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LC Fee 7-31D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351857 Fee OW
LC Tribal 5-31D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351858 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 8-33-45 33 040S 050W 301351859 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 16-31-45 040S 050W m351863 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 7-23D-45 23 040S_ 050W 4301351865 Indian OW
LC Tribal 1-23D-56 23 050S 060W 43 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-19-56 19 050S 060W 4301351867 Indian OW APD
ÚCTRIBAL 7-19D-56 19 050S 060W 4301351868 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-4D-56 4 OSOS 060W 4301351869 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 14-32D-45 32 4301351879 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 7-17D-56 17 _ 05 4301351886 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 5-17D-56 17 OSOS 060W 4301351887 Indian OW APD
ÜC FEE 4-32D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351892 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-2D-56 2 050S 060W 4301351893 Indian OW APD
ÚC TRIBAL 1-2D-56 050S 060W 4301351894 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 15-23D-45 3 040S 050W 4301351895 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL ll-34D-56 34 0 060W 4301351900 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-5D-56 4 050S 060W 4301351901 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 10-28D-45 28 040S 050W 4301351903 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13-20D-56 0 050S 060W 4301351904 Indian OW APD
Ute Tribal 14-17-55 17 050S 050W 4301351908 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 3-27D-45 27 040S 050W 4301351911 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-34D-56 050S 060W Indian OW APD
ÒC Fee 8R-9-37 9 030S 070W 430135193i Fee OW APD
LC Tribal 10-33D 33 40S 50W 4301351939 Indian D
LC Tribal 14-33D-45 33 040S 050W 4301351940 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal 10-27D-45 27 40S 050W 4301351941 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal 14-27D-45 27 040S 050W 4301351951 Indian OW APD

33 040S 050W 4301351955 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal 6-32D-45 32 040S 050W 4301351956 Indian OW APD
Federal 3-11D-65 11 060S 050W 4 Federal OW APD
Federal 2-4-64 4 4301351983 Federal W APD
Federal 5-11D-65 060S 050W 4301351984 ederal W APD
Federal 7-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301351985 ederal OW APD
Federal 3-4D-64 060S 040W 4301351986 Federal OW APD
Federal 8-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301351988 Federal
Federa16-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301351989 Federal OW APD
Federal 7-9D-64 9 4301351990 eral OW APD
Federal 4-4D-64 4 060S 040 4301351991 ederal OW APD
Federa19-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352004 ederal W APD
Federal 10-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352011 ederal W APD
Federal 3-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352015 ederal W APD
Federal 1-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352020 ederal W APD
Federal 6-9-64 060S 040W 4301352021 Federal OW APD
Federal 8-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352023 Federal W APD
Federal 1-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352 Federal APD
Federal l6-4D-64 4 060S 040W 301352026 Federal OW APD
LC Tribal 10-23D-45 040S 050W 301352029 OW
Federal 15-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352032 Meral OW APD
Federal 5-9D-64 9 060S 040W 43 FederaÏ
Federal 9-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352036 Federal OW APD
Federal 11-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352037 Federal OW APD
Federal 12-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352038 Federal OW Am
Federal 13-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352039 FederaÏ OW APD
FEDERAL 14-9D-64 9 OS 040W 4301352040 Fede OW APD
Federal 10-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352041 Federal OW APD
Federal 2-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352042 Federal OW APD
Federal 15-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352043 Federal OW APD
Federal 16-9D-64 9 060S 040W 301352044 Federal OW APD
LC Tribal 10-32D-45 2 040S 301352065 In an
LC Tribal 16-28D-45 040S 050W 301352073 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 15-24D-45 04 50W 4301352074 OW D
LC Tribal 13-17D-56 17 050S 060W 4301352076 an OW D
LC Tribal 15-17D-56 050S 060W 4301352077 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 5-26D-56 26 050S 060W 01352097 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal ll-26D-56 26 050S 060W 4301352098 Indian OW APD
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LC Fee 7-31D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351857 Fee OW
LC Tribal 5-31D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351858 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 8-33-45 33 040S 050W 301351859 Indian OW APD
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LC Tribal 1-23D-56 23 050S 060W 43 Indian OW APD
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LC Tribal 15-23D-45 3 040S 050W 4301351895 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL ll-34D-56 34 0 060W 4301351900 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-5D-56 4 050S 060W 4301351901 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 10-28D-45 28 040S 050W 4301351903 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13-20D-56 0 050S 060W 4301351904 Indian OW APD
Ute Tribal 14-17-55 17 050S 050W 4301351908 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 3-27D-45 27 040S 050W 4301351911 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-34D-56 050S 060W Indian OW APD
ÒC Fee 8R-9-37 9 030S 070W 430135193i Fee OW APD
LC Tribal 10-33D 33 40S 50W 4301351939 Indian D
LC Tribal 14-33D-45 33 040S 050W 4301351940 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal 10-27D-45 27 40S 050W 4301351941 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal 14-27D-45 27 040S 050W 4301351951 Indian OW APD

33 040S 050W 4301351955 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal 6-32D-45 32 040S 050W 4301351956 Indian OW APD
Federal 3-11D-65 11 060S 050W 4 Federal OW APD
Federal 2-4-64 4 4301351983 Federal W APD
Federal 5-11D-65 060S 050W 4301351984 ederal W APD
Federal 7-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301351985 ederal OW APD
Federal 3-4D-64 060S 040W 4301351986 Federal OW APD
Federal 8-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301351988 Federal
Federa16-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301351989 Federal OW APD
Federal 7-9D-64 9 4301351990 eral OW APD
Federal 4-4D-64 4 060S 040 4301351991 ederal OW APD
Federa19-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352004 ederal W APD
Federal 10-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352011 ederal W APD
Federal 3-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352015 ederal W APD
Federal 1-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352020 ederal W APD
Federal 6-9-64 060S 040W 4301352021 Federal OW APD
Federal 8-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352023 Federal W APD
Federal 1-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352 Federal APD
Federal l6-4D-64 4 060S 040W 301352026 Federal OW APD
LC Tribal 10-23D-45 040S 050W 301352029 OW
Federal 15-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301352032 Meral OW APD
Federal 5-9D-64 9 060S 040W 43 FederaÏ
Federal 9-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352036 Federal OW APD
Federal 11-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352037 Federal OW APD
Federal 12-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352038 Federal OW Am
Federal 13-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352039 FederaÏ OW APD
FEDERAL 14-9D-64 9 OS 040W 4301352040 Fede OW APD
Federal 10-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352041 Federal OW APD
Federal 2-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352042 Federal OW APD
Federal 15-9D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352043 Federal OW APD
Federal 16-9D-64 9 060S 040W 301352044 Federal OW APD
LC Tribal 10-32D-45 2 040S 301352065 In an
LC Tribal 16-28D-45 040S 050W 301352073 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 15-24D-45 04 50W 4301352074 OW D
LC Tribal 13-17D-56 17 050S 060W 4301352076 an OW D
LC Tribal 15-17D-56 050S 060W 4301352077 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 5-26D-56 26 050S 060W 01352097 Indian OW PD
LC Tribal ll-26D-56 26 050S 060W 4301352098 Indian OW APD
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

LC Tribal 13-26D-56 26 050S 060W 4301352099 Indian OW _ APD
LC Tribal 2-27D-45 27 040S 050W 4301352100 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 8-27D-45 27 040S 050W 4301352101 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 4-9D-56 9 050S 060W 4301352102 Indian OW APD
LC Tribal 8-32D-45 32 040S 050W 4301352135 Indian OW APD
UTE Tribal 15-24D-54 24 050S 040W 4301352156 Indian GW APD
UTE Tribal 9-24D-54 24 050S 040W 4301352157 Indian GW APD
UTE Tribal 1-25D-54 25 050S 040W 4301352173 Indian GW APD
UTE Tribal 9-25D-54 25 OSOS 040W 4301352177 Indian GW APD
Myrin Tribal 9-10D-55 10 OSOS 050W 4301352189 Indian OW APD
Myrin Triba1 16-10D-55 10 050S 050W 4301352190 Indian OW APD
Myrin Tribal 10-10D-55 10 OSOS 050W 4301352191 Indian OW APD
UTE Tribal 1-24D-54 24 050S 040W 4301352304 Indian GW APD
UTE Triba17-24D-54 24 050S 040W 4301352306 Indian GW
UTE Tribal l2-25D-54 25 050S 040W 4301352308 Indian GW APD
UTE Tribal 4-13D-54 13 050S 040W 4301352321 Indian GW APD
UTE Tribal 13-25D-54 25 050S 040W 4301352322 Indian GW APD
Abbott Fee 1-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352324 Fee OW APD
Abbott Fee 7-6D-54 OSOS 040W 4301352327 Fee OW APD
UTE Tribal 3-24D-54 24 050S 040W 4301352347 Indian GW APD
UTE Tribal 5-24D-54 24 050S 040W 4301352348 Indian GW APD
State Tribal 7-12D-55 12 050S 050W 4301352369 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 14-lD-55 1 050S 050W 4301352372 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 11-lD-55 1 050S 050W 4301352373 Indian OW

ribal 13-1D-55 1 050S 050W 352374 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 12-2D-55 2 050S 050W 4301352391 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 14-2D-55 2 050S 050W 4301352392 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 13-2D-55 2 OSOS 050W 4301352395 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 14-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352430 Indian W APD
State Tribal ll-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352434 Indian W R
State Tribal 13-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352435 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 2-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352450 Indian OW APD
Ute Tribal 1-5D-55 5 050W 4301352456 Indian OW APD BRUNDAGE CANYON
Ute Tribal 7-5-55 5 050S 050W 4301352459 Indian OW APD
ÜteTribal 3-16D-54 9 040W 4301352467 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 1-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352471 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 2-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352472 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 7-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352473 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 8-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352474 Indian APD
UTE FEE 10-9D-54 9 OSOS 040W 4301352475 Fee OW APD
UK FEE 12-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352476 Fee OW APD
UTE FEE 16-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352478 Fee OW APD
Ute Tribal 2-16D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352481 Indian OW APD
Federal 14-6D-65 6 060S 05 W 4301352 95 Federal OW APD
Federal 13-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352496 Federal OW APD
Federal ll-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352497 Federal OW APD
Federal 10-6D-65 6 050W 4301352498 Federal OW APD
State Tribal 3-3D-55 3 050S 1352532 Indian OW APD

Tribal 4-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352533 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 5-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352535 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 6-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352536 Indian OW APD
Federal 2-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352537 Federal _C)W APD
Federal 5-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352538 Federal OW APD
Federal 4-7D-65 _ 7 060S _ 050W 43 Federal OW APD
UTEFEEll-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352544 Fee OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-12D-55 12 0 4301352 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-5D-55 5 050S Ï3013 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 5-5D-55 5 050S 050W 43 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352558 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 3-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352559 Indian OW APD
Federal 3-7-65 7 060S 50W 4300Ï35!560 Federal OW APD
UteTribal9-llD-55 050S 50W 4301352564 Ïn BW APD
UTE TRIBAL 10-11D-55 1 050S 50W 4301352566 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-11D-55 050S 50W 4301352567 Indian OW APD
Federal 1-7D-65 6 060S 50W 001352589 Federal OW APD
Federal 16-6D-65 6 1060S 0W 4301352590 Federal OW APD
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UTE Tribal 15-24D-54 24 050S 040W 4301352156 Indian GW APD
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UTE Tribal 1-25D-54 25 050S 040W 4301352173 Indian GW APD
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State Tribal 13-2D-55 2 OSOS 050W 4301352395 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 14-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352430 Indian W APD
State Tribal ll-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352434 Indian W R
State Tribal 13-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352435 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 2-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352450 Indian OW APD
Ute Tribal 1-5D-55 5 050W 4301352456 Indian OW APD BRUNDAGE CANYON
Ute Tribal 7-5-55 5 050S 050W 4301352459 Indian OW APD
ÜteTribal 3-16D-54 9 040W 4301352467 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 1-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352471 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 2-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352472 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 7-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352473 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 8-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352474 Indian APD
UTE FEE 10-9D-54 9 OSOS 040W 4301352475 Fee OW APD
UK FEE 12-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352476 Fee OW APD
UTE FEE 16-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352478 Fee OW APD
Ute Tribal 2-16D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352481 Indian OW APD
Federal 14-6D-65 6 060S 05 W 4301352 95 Federal OW APD
Federal 13-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352496 Federal OW APD
Federal ll-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352497 Federal OW APD
Federal 10-6D-65 6 050W 4301352498 Federal OW APD
State Tribal 3-3D-55 3 050S 1352532 Indian OW APD

Tribal 4-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352533 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 5-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352535 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 6-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352536 Indian OW APD
Federal 2-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352537 Federal _C)W APD
Federal 5-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352538 Federal OW APD
Federal 4-7D-65 _ 7 060S _ 050W 43 Federal OW APD
UTEFEEll-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352544 Fee OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-12D-55 12 0 4301352 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-5D-55 5 050S Ï3013 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 5-5D-55 5 050S 050W 43 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352558 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 3-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352559 Indian OW APD
Federal 3-7-65 7 060S 50W 4300Ï35!560 Federal OW APD
UteTribal9-llD-55 050S 50W 4301352564 Ïn BW APD
UTE TRIBAL 10-11D-55 1 050S 50W 4301352566 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-11D-55 050S 50W 4301352567 Indian OW APD
Federal 1-7D-65 6 060S 50W 001352589 Federal OW APD
Federal 16-6D-65 6 1060S 0W 4301352590 Federal OW APD
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UTE Tribal 4-13D-54 13 050S 040W 4301352321 Indian GW APD
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ribal 13-1D-55 1 050S 050W 352374 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 12-2D-55 2 050S 050W 4301352391 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 14-2D-55 2 050S 050W 4301352392 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 13-2D-55 2 OSOS 050W 4301352395 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 14-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352430 Indian W APD
State Tribal ll-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352434 Indian W R
State Tribal 13-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352435 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 2-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352450 Indian OW APD
Ute Tribal 1-5D-55 5 050W 4301352456 Indian OW APD BRUNDAGE CANYON
Ute Tribal 7-5-55 5 050S 050W 4301352459 Indian OW APD
ÜteTribal 3-16D-54 9 040W 4301352467 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 1-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352471 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 2-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352472 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 7-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352473 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 8-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352474 Indian APD
UTE FEE 10-9D-54 9 OSOS 040W 4301352475 Fee OW APD
UK FEE 12-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352476 Fee OW APD
UTE FEE 16-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352478 Fee OW APD
Ute Tribal 2-16D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352481 Indian OW APD
Federal 14-6D-65 6 060S 05 W 4301352 95 Federal OW APD
Federal 13-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352496 Federal OW APD
Federal ll-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352497 Federal OW APD
Federal 10-6D-65 6 050W 4301352498 Federal OW APD
State Tribal 3-3D-55 3 050S 1352532 Indian OW APD

Tribal 4-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352533 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 5-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352535 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 6-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352536 Indian OW APD
Federal 2-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352537 Federal _C)W APD
Federal 5-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352538 Federal OW APD
Federal 4-7D-65 _ 7 060S _ 050W 43 Federal OW APD
UTEFEEll-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352544 Fee OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-12D-55 12 0 4301352 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-5D-55 5 050S Ï3013 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 5-5D-55 5 050S 050W 43 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352558 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 3-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352559 Indian OW APD
Federal 3-7-65 7 060S 50W 4300Ï35!560 Federal OW APD
UteTribal9-llD-55 050S 50W 4301352564 Ïn BW APD
UTE TRIBAL 10-11D-55 1 050S 50W 4301352566 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-11D-55 050S 50W 4301352567 Indian OW APD
Federal 1-7D-65 6 060S 50W 001352589 Federal OW APD
Federal 16-6D-65 6 1060S 0W 4301352590 Federal OW APD
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLCN4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

Federal 15-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352591 Federal OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 14-12D-55 12 050S 050W 4301352592 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13-12D-55 12 050S 050W 4301352593 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 10-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352603 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 9-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352604 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-11-54 11 050S 040W 4301352605 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352606 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 14-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352610 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352611 __ Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 12-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352612 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 11-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352613 Indian OW APD
Federa16-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352682 Federal OW APD
Federa ll-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352683 Federal OW APD
Federal 10-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352684 Federal OW APD
Federal 7-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352685 Federal OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 14-30D-55 30 050S 050W 4301352687 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13-30D-55 30 050S 050W 4301352688 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 12-30D-55 30 _ 050S 050W 4301352689 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL ll-30D-55 30 050S 050W 4301352690 Indian OW APD
ÜIE TRIBAL 7-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301352691 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301352692 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 3-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301352693 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 2-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301352694 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301352695 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 3-12D-55 12 050S 050W 4301352697 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 4-12D-55 12 050S 050W 4301352698 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 12-31D-55 31 050S 050W 4301352699 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13-31D-55 31 OSOS 050W 4301352700 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 14-31D-55 31 050S 050W 4301352701 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 14-13D-54 13 050S 040W 4301352702 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 11-31-55 31 050S 050W 4301352703 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 3-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352704 Indian OW APD
State Triba14-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352705 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 5-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352706 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 6-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352707 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 8-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352708 Indian OW APD
StateTribal7-llD-55 11 050S 050W 4301352709 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 2-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352710 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 1-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352711 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 9-4D-55 4 050S 050W 4301352713 Indian OW APD
StateTribal2-10D-55 10 050S 050W 4301352714 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 7-10D-55 10 OSOS 050W 4301352715 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 8-10D-55 10 050S 050W 4301352716 Indian OW APD
ÜTÃTRIBAL 10-4D-55 OSOS 050W 4301352717 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-4D-55 4 050S 050W 4301352718 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 1-10D-55 10 050S 050W 4301352720 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-4D-55 4 050S 050W 4301352721 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 3-10D-55 10 050S 050W 4301352723 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 4-10D-55 10 050S 050W 4301352724 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 5-10D-55 10 050S 050W 4301352725 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 6-10D-55 10 _ 050S 050W 4301352726 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 11-5D-55 050S 050W 4301352727 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 12-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352728 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352729 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 14-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352730 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 9-30D-55 30 050S 050W 4301352731 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 15-2D-55 2 050S 050W 4301352732 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 16-2D-55 2 OSOS 050W 4301352733 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 10-2D-55 2 OSOS 050W 4301352734 Indian OW APD
State Tribal9-2D-55 2 050S 050W 1301352735 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 10-30D-55 30 OSOS 050W 4301352736 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-30D-55 050S 050W 4301352737 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-30D-55 050S 050W 4301352738 Man OW
Myrin Tribal 9-19D-55 19 0Š0S 50W 4301352739 dian OW APD
State Tribal 16-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352740 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 15-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352741 OW APD
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UTE TRIBAL 12-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352612 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 11-11D-55 11 050S 050W 4301352613 Indian OW APD
Federa16-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352682 Federal OW APD
Federa ll-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352683 Federal OW APD
Federal 10-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352684 Federal OW APD
Federal 7-7D-65 7 060S 050W 4301352685 Federal OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 14-30D-55 30 050S 050W 4301352687 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13-30D-55 30 050S 050W 4301352688 Indian OW APD
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UTE TRIBAL 2-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301352694 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301352695 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 3-12D-55 12 050S 050W 4301352697 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 4-12D-55 12 050S 050W 4301352698 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 12-31D-55 31 050S 050W 4301352699 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13-31D-55 31 OSOS 050W 4301352700 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 14-31D-55 31 050S 050W 4301352701 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 14-13D-54 13 050S 040W 4301352702 Indian OW APD
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UTE TRIBAL 16-4D-55 4 050S 050W 4301352721 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 3-10D-55 10 050S 050W 4301352723 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 4-10D-55 10 050S 050W 4301352724 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 5-10D-55 10 050S 050W 4301352725 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 6-10D-55 10 _ 050S 050W 4301352726 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 11-5D-55 050S 050W 4301352727 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 12-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352728 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352729 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 14-5D-55 5 050S 050W 4301352730 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 9-30D-55 30 050S 050W 4301352731 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 15-2D-55 2 050S 050W 4301352732 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 16-2D-55 2 OSOS 050W 4301352733 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 10-2D-55 2 OSOS 050W 4301352734 Indian OW APD
State Tribal9-2D-55 2 050S 050W 1301352735 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 10-30D-55 30 OSOS 050W 4301352736 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 15-30D-55 050S 050W 4301352737 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-30D-55 050S 050W 4301352738 Man OW
Myrin Tribal 9-19D-55 19 0Š0S 50W 4301352739 dian OW APD
State Tribal 16-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352740 Indian OW APD
State Tribal 15-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352741 OW APD
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State Tribal 10-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352742 Indian OW APD
State Triba19-3D-55 3 050S 050W 4301352743 Indian OW APD
Myrin Tribal 15-19D-55 19 050S 050W 4301352744 Indian OW APD
Myrin Tribal 13-19D-55 19 050S 050W 4301352745 Indian OW APD
Myrin Tribal 12-19D-55 19 050S 050W 4301352746 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 5-4D-55 4 050S 050W 4301352747 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-4D-55 4 050S 050W 4301352748 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 3-4D-55 4 050S 050W 4301352749 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-4D-55 4 050S 050W 4301352754 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 3-31D-55 31 050S 050W 4301352757 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 5-31D-55 31 OSOS 050W 4301352758 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-55 31 050S 050W 4301352759 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 7-31D-55 050S 050W 4301352764 Indian_ OW
Myrin Tribal 11-19D-55 19 050S 050W 4301352765 an OW APD
Federal 8-14D-65 14 060S 050W 4301352767 _ Federal OW APD
Federal 7-14D-65 14 060S 050W 4301352768 Federal OW APD
FÄal 2-14D-65 14 060S 050W 4301352769 Federal OW APD
Federal 1-14D-65 14 060S 050W 4301352770 Federal OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 8-5D-55 5 OSOS 050W 4301352773 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-31D-55 31 050S 050W 4301352795 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-30D-55 30 OSOS 050W 4301352796 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 5-30D-55 30 050S 050W 4301352797 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 7-30D-55 30 050S 050W 4301352799 Indian OW APD
Federal 1-13D-65 13 060S 050W 4301352800 Federal OW APD
Federal 7-13D-65 13 060S 050W 4301352802 Federal OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 1-30D-55 30 050S 050W 4301352809 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 6-25D-56 25 050S 060W 4301352810 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 4-25D-56 25 050S 060W 4301352812 Indian OW APD
Federa16-13D-65 13 060S 050W 4301352813 Federal OW APD
Federa14-13D-65 13 060S 050W 4301352814 Federal OW APD
Federal 3-13D-65 13 060S 050W 4301352815 Federal OW APD
Federal 3-16D-64 16 060S 040W 4301352823 Federal OW APD
Federal 4-16D-64_ 16 060S 040W 4301352824 Federal OW APD
Federal 5-16D-64 16 060S 040W 4301352825 Federal OW APD
Federal 6-16D-64_ 16 060S 040W 4301352826 Federal OW APD
Federa1 5-13D-65 13 060S 050W 4301352827 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAL 1-25D-56 25 OSOS 060W 4301352835 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 2-25D-56 25 050S 060W 4301352836 Indian OW
LC TRIBAL 8-25D-56 25 050S 060W 4301352837 Indian OW APD
UTE FEE 1-13D-55 13 050S 050W 4301352838 Fee OW APD
LC TRIBAL 9-25D-56 25 OSOS 060W 4301352840 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 15-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301352844 Indian OW APD
Federal 9-5D-65 5 060S 050W 4301352846 Federal OW APD
Federal 10-5D-65 5 060S 050W 4301352847 Federal OW APD
LC TRIBAL 16-25D-56 25 050S 060W 4301352848 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 10-25D-56 25 050S 060W 4301352849 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 8-30D-55 29 050S 050W 4301352855 Indian OW APD
ÌÏTE TRIBAL 9-2555 29 050S 05Ö ÏÏl352870 Ïndian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-24D-55 24 OSOS 050W 4301352871 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 16-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301352872 Man OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 13-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301352882 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 4-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301352883 Indian OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 1-29D-55 9 050S 050W 4301352884 Indian OW APD
Federal 4-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301352885 Federal OW APD
Federal 5-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301352886 Federal OW APD
Federal 12-2D-65 060S 050W 4301352887 Federal OM
LC TRIBAL 12-25D-56 25 050S 060W 4301352888 an OW APD
LC TRIBAL 13-25D-56 25 050S 060W 4301352890 Indian OW APD
LC TRIBAL 14-25D-56 25 050S 060W 4301352891 Indian OW APD
Federal 15-3D-65 3 060S 050W 4301352892 Federal OW APD
Federal 9-3D-65 060S 050W 4301352893 ederal OW APD
Federal 8-3D-65 3 060S 050W 4301352894 Federal OW APD
Feder 6-3D-65 _ 3 OS 050W 01352895 deral OW APD
UTE TRIBAL 6-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301334056 185 W RL
MOON TRIBAL 9-27D-54 OS 040W 4301334108 19095 Indian OW RL
LC TRIBAL 9-16D-56 i16 050S 060W 4301350600 99999 Indian OW DRL
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LC TRIBAL 15-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301352844 Indian OW APD
Federal 9-5D-65 5 060S 050W 4301352846 Federal OW APD
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LC TRIBAL 16-25D-56 25 050S 060W 4301352848 Indian OW APD
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Federal 9-3D-65 060S 050W 4301352893 ederal OW APD
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UTE TRIBAL 6-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301334056 185 W RL
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

FEDERAL 15-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301351219 18793 Federal OW DRL
UTE TRIBAL 9-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301351258 19401 Man OW DRL
ÑTÃTE TRIBAL 2-12D-55 12 OSOS 050W 4301351310 19444 Indian OW DRL
UE TRIBAL 7-10D-54 10 040W 4301351365 19391 Indian OW DRL
LC TRIBAL 9-26D-56 26 060W 4301351381 19433 Indian OW DRL
UTE TRIBAL 8-17D-55 17 050S 050W 4301351413 19388 Indian OW DRL
LC TRIBAL 9-24D-45 24 040S 050W 4301351431 18861 Indian OW DRL
LC TRIBAL 2-29D-45 050W 4301351705 99999 Indian OW DRL
LC TAYLOR FEE 14-22D-56 22 OSOS 060W 4301351744 19508 Fee OW DRL
LC FEE 14-6D-56 6 050S 060W 4301351787 18910 Fee OW DRL
LC FEE 15-6-56 6 OSOS 060W 4301351792 19334 Fee OW DRL
LC Fee 14-36D-56 36 050S 060W 4301351878 19376 Fee OW DRL
I C Fee 12-36-56 36 050S 060W 4301351883 19377 ee DRL
LC Tribal 6-29D-45 29 040S 050W 4301351902 19402 Indian OW DRL
Federal 4-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352005 19173 Federal OW DRL
Federal 12-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352006 19174 Federal OW DRL
UTE Tribal 14-18D-54 18 050S 040W 4301352213 19509 Indian GW DRL
UTE Tribal 15-31D-55 31 0 50W 4301352309 19472 Indian GW DRL
UTE Tribal 16-31D-55 31 OSOS 050W 4301352318 19473 Indian GW DRL
State Tribal 1-12D-55 12 050W 4301352390 19445 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 16-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352394 19424 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 10-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352395 19425 Indian OW DRL
State Triba19-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352396 19426 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 7-7D-54 7 050S 040W 4301352426 19496 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 1-7D-54 7 050S 040W 4301352427 19497 Indian DRL
State Tribal 2-7D-54 050S 040W 4301352428 19498 Indian OW _ DRL
State Tribal 3-7D-54 7 050S 040W 4301352429 19517 Indian OW DRL
State Triba14-7D-54 7 050S 040W 4301352431 99999 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 5-7D-54 7 050S 040W 4301352432 99999 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 6-7D-54 7 050S 040W 4301352433 19518 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 11-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352452 1947gan _ _ OW DRL
State Tribal l2-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352453 19475 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 13-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352454 19476 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 14-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352455 19477 Indian OW DRL
Ute Tribal 1-9D-54 9 OSOS 040W 4301352465 19356 Indian OW DRL
Ute Triba17-9D-54 9 040W 4301352466 19357 Indian OW DRL
UTE TRIBAL 12-5D-54 050S_ 040W 4301352480 19499 Indian OW DRL
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-54 5 050S i040W 4301352484 19500 Indian OW DRL
UTE TRIBAL 14-SD-54 5 050S 040W 4301352493 19510 Indian _ OW DRL
State Tribal 13-11D-54 10 050S 040W 4301352561 19519 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 1-18D-54 18 050S 040W 4301352568 19434 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 2-18D-54 18 050S 040W 4301352576 19427 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 8-18D-54 18 050S 040W 4301352577 19428 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 4-18D-54 18 050S 040W 301352607 19435 Indian OW_ DRL
State Tribal 3-18D-54 18 050S 040W 301352608 19436 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 6-18D-54 050S 04 i30135260919437 Indian OW DRL

te Tribal 5-12-55 12 4301352643 19446 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 12-12D-55 U 050S 050W 4301352644 19447 Indian W DRL
State Tribal 6-12D-55 12 050S 050W 4301352645 19438 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 16-lD-55 050S 050W 4301352646 19483 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 15-1D-55 1 050S 050W 4301352647 19484 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 10-1D-55 1 050S 050W 4301352648 19485 Indian OW DRL
State Tribal 9-lD-55 1 1352649 19486 IndÏan DRL
I FEE 16-15D-56 Ï4 05()S 4301352655 19520 Fee OW DRL
LC Tribal 2-22D-56 22 050S 060W 4301352663 99999 Indian OW DRL
LC Tribal 3-22D-56 22 OSOS 060W 4301352664 99999 Indian OW DRL
F ral 2-13-65 13 Ï)60S 050W 4301352801 950ÏFederal OW DRL
Federal 8-13D-65 13 060S 050W 4301352803 19502 Federal OW DRL
Federal 12-8D-64 7 060S 040W 4301352832 99999 Federal OW DRL
Federal 5-8D-64 7 060S 040W 4301352833 99999 Federal OW DRL
Federal 4-8D-64 7 060S 040W 4301352834 99999 Federal OW DRL
Federal 3-8D-64 S 040W 01352845 19503 Federal
LC TRIBAL 4H-31-56 31 050S 060W 4301351738 Indian OW NEW
Federal 14-7D-65 1 050S 06g351910 Indian W
L Fee 11-22-57 050S 070W 4301352127 Fee OW NEW
LC Fee 13-22D-57 22 050S 070W 4301352131 Fee OW NEW
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UTE FEE 13-9D-54 __ _ __ _ ~ __ 050S 040W 4301352906 -=J£ee ____ OW . NEW_' _____ ~ ______ _ 
UTE FEE 2-34D-55 _= ____ ~_ 27 ___ 050S 1050W4301352971 I~~----~ INEW. 1 ~ ___ . _____ _ 
Federal 13-7D-65 7 1060S 050W 4301352974 I Federal ~_ NEW _ _ _ ___ . _____ _ 
Federal 14-7D-65 --. --=-=--=--=---17- _ 060S 1050W,4301352975±=' - Federal. - ,OW ,NEW -=t---------~--
UTE TRIBAL6-27D-55 -------=m 050S 1050W 14301352976 Indian ___ --~ INEW- ____________ _ 
LC Nielsen Tribal 12-27D-56 ~-.-1t=27 _. 050S 060W 4301352977 IIndian . __ ~---== __ NEW_---i--- ________ . __ 

LCNielsen Tribal 13-27D-56 ____ __ 27 050S060W 14301352978 I . Indian . ~--. 'INEW + ___ .. ___ ~ _____ _ 
LC Nielsen Tribal 16-28D-56 ,27 -r050S 060W 4301352979L_ ·IIndian __ ~_ NEW . 
LCNielsenFee9~28D:~_____ __ 127 050S

'
060W 4301352980 t=1 Fee._ ,OW _ NEW~-- _______ _ 

LCFEE9-36D-56 ________ 136 050S 060W 4301352982 _ Fee _ ~ NEW .-=----C ___________ _ 
~~ ~:B~t:~~~-56 __ ~_=_==lli-. - :;:~ I:::: ;:::::;;::u--: [;:.:,'" --1}=- ::=-t= ..-=-~--=--
LC TRIBAL 5-36D-56 ___________ ~ 050S 060W 4301352985 _~ndian _~ OW_. NEW _ '. ___ ._ .. ______ _ 

LC TRIBAL 4-36D-56 ___ . __ ._ -ll-~-- 050S i060W'4301352986 1 -indian _ OW _ INEW "1------------
~~ i~:~ ;~~~~~~.~ ---~ .. --. - --.1M.- -. -~~~~ !~:~: T:~~!~~;:~.~--I~~:::--~ ,~: -... - I~~:----I--~ -----------~= 
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UTE TRIBAL 13-3R-54 .--. __ .. -.-_ .2. 3 050S 040W 4301330924 19488 Indian. 1Ow-· _ OPS. _ i __ ._. __ .-.-. _. __ 
UTE TRIBAL 3-20D-55 .. _~ ,050S 050W 4301333280 118424 Indian ~ =m=PS -I 
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~_~~~~~~~;~~~55-- .- -=--=-~~+¥o----- I~:~~ i~~~: I:~~~~~~~;~ I ~~~~~ !~~::: -- \~: ---r~~~ -==[ -:-- ~-.--- ---.-
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J&-TRIBAL2-33D-4~ _________ 33 ___ 1040S 1050Wi4301351402 18854 lndian ____ IO~ ___ OPS _~ __________ _ 
~C TRIBAL 9-3D-56 _________ u= __ 050S 1060W,4301351514 ,18948 Indi~ __ Tow -ms _ _ ______ _ 
~ibaI3-34D-56 _ __ __ __ _ _ 34 _ 050S~OWg1352087 [19234kdian ____ PW __ OPS _ J- __ __ __ _ ____ _ 
LC; Tribal 7-34D-5~ _ __ _ _ __ _ ... ~ fo50S ,060\\'-I-4~(1l352088 J2p5)ndian _ lOW ip~ _....:. _ _ __ __ _ _ _ 
~te TribaI5-9D-5L__ ____ _______ . Jf---.fo50S ~~t¥.01352463 11935.4 [ Indian. ------- .. -~~-. - JQ!'L .-. t-I, .-.--- __ .. _._._ 

~M~~:~~:22-- ------ --n-B2-t~1~~ ~~~;~~~: 1~:;~5 :~~~: ----f§-}-----WL --T -- - ------
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLCN4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

LC Tribal 5-22D-57 22 OSOS 070W 4301352133 Indian OW NEWin:bb D 4 OW

LC Tribal 13-18D-56 050S 060W 4301352141 Indian W NEW
Tribal 15-18D-56 050S 060W 301352142 OW NEW

LC Triba17-18D-56 18 050S 060W 301352153 Indian OW NEW
LC Tribal 5-18D-56 18 050S 060W 301352154 Indian W NEW
LC Tribal 3-18-56 050S 060W 301352155 OW NEW
LC Tribal 6-19D-56 19 050S 060W 4301352247 Indian OW NEW
LC Tribal 4-19D-56 19 050S 060W 4301352248 Indian OW NEW
Abbott Fee 3-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352325 Fee EW
LC Fee 9-11D-56 11 050S 060W 4301352479 EW
Williams Tribal 8-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352650 Indian OW NEW
Williams Triba17-4D-54 4 OSOS 040W 4301352651 Indian OW NEW
Williams Tribal 2-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352652 Indian OW NEW
Williams Tribal 1-4D-54 050S 040W 4301352653 Indian OW NEW
Federa19-8D-64 _ 060S 040W 4301352880 Federal OW NEW
Federal 16-8D-64 9 060S 040W 4301352881 Federal OW NEW
LC Nielsen Tribal 6-33D-56 3 050S 060W 4301352896 OW NEW
LC Nielsen Tribal 2-33D-56 3 050S 060W 301352897 Indian OW NEW
LC Nielsen Tribal 4-33D-56 33 050S 060W 430135289 OW NEW
LC Nielsen Tribal 5-33D-56 050S 3013 Indian OW
UTE FEE 13-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301352906 Fee OW NEW
UTE FEE 2-34D-55 27 50S 50W 4301352971 Fee OW NEW
Federal 13-7D-65 7 60S 50W 4301352974 Federal OW NEW
Federal 14-7D-65 7_ 60S 50W 4301352975 ral ONW NEW
UTE TRIBAL 6-27D-55 27 50S 050W 4301352976 NEW
LC Nielsen Tribal 12-27D-56 27 SOS 60W 4301352977 Indian OW EW
LC Nielsen Tribal 13-27D-56 50S 60W 4301352978 OW EW
LC Nielsen Tribal 16-28D-56 27 50S 60W 4301352979 India
LC Nielsen Fee 9-28D-56 27 050S 060W 4301352980 Fee OW EW
LC FEE 9-36D-56 060W Fee W
LC FEE 15-36D-56 36 050S 060W 4301352983 Fee OW EW
LC TRIBAL 6-36D-56 050S 060W 430 Indian OW EW
LC TRIBAL 5-36D-56 36 050S 060W 4301352985 Indian OW EW
LC TRIBAL 4-36D-56 ½ 050S 060W 4301352986 OW EW
LC TRIBAL 3-36D-56 36 50S 060W 4301352987 Indian EW
LC TRIBAL 2-35D-56 35 050S 060W 4301352988 Indian OW EW
LC TRIBAL 1-35D-56 35 OSOS 060W 4301352989 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 13-3R-54 3 050S 040W 4301330924 9488 ndian
UTE TRIBAL 3-20D-55 20 050S 050W 4301333280 18424 dian OW OPS
LC TRIBAL 4H-17-56 17 050S 060W 4301333540 18067 Indian OW OPS
LC TRIBAL 16-21-46 21 040S 060W 4301333575 16156 Indian W OPS
UTE TRIBAL 8-20D-55 20 OSOS 050W 4301333676 17308 ndian OW OPS
UTE TRIBAL 14-14D-55 050S 050W W OP
UTE TRIBAL 5-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333740 17306 Indian W OPS
UTE TRIBAL 7-32D-55 050S 050W 301333794 18359 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 12-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301333798 18360 Indian
FOY 9-33D-55 33 050S 050W 4301333802 17125 Fee OW OPS
BERRY TRIBAL 2-23D-54 iÏ 050S 040W 430Ï33380Ì18546 Indian W ŒS
UTE TRIBAL 13-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333807 18378 Indian OW OPS
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333887 18594 Indian OW OPS
LC FEE 8-15D-56 15 050S 060W 4301350597 19347 Fee OW OPS
SFW FEE 13-10D-54 10 050S 301350892 19186 Fee W OPS
SFW TRIBAL l l-10D-54 10 1350893 19215 Indian OW S
LC TRIBAL SHH-5-56 4 050S 060W 4301350927 18463 Indian OW OPS
LC TRIBAL 16-34D-45 W 01350977 18658 Indian S
LC TRIBAL 3-4D-56 4 OSOS 060W 4301351000 18852 Indian OW OPS
FEDERAL 7-12D-65 2 050W 18717 Federal W S
LC TRIBAL 2-33D-45 33 040S 050W 4301351402 18854 Indian OW OPS
LC TRIBAL 9-3D-56 060W 301351514 18948 OW S
LC Tribal 3-34D-56 34 OSOS 060W 4301352087 4 Bdian OW OPS
LC Triba17-34D-56 _ _ 050S W 301352088 9235 Indian OW OPS
Ute Tribal 5-9D-54 _ __ 050S 040W 301352463 19354 Indian OW OPS
Ute Tribal 3-9D-54 9 OSOS 040W 4301352464 19355 Indian OW OPS
BC UTE TRIBAL 4-22 i2 050S 040W 301330755 2620 Indian OW

Berry Petroleum Company, LLCN4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

LC Tribal 5-22D-57 22 OSOS 070W 4301352133 Indian OW NEWin:bb D 4 OW

LC Tribal 13-18D-56 050S 060W 4301352141 Indian W NEW
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LC TRIBAL 1-35D-56 35 OSOS 060W 4301352989 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 13-3R-54 3 050S 040W 4301330924 9488 ndian
UTE TRIBAL 3-20D-55 20 050S 050W 4301333280 18424 dian OW OPS
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UTE TRIBAL 8-20D-55 20 OSOS 050W 4301333676 17308 ndian OW OPS
UTE TRIBAL 14-14D-55 050S 050W W OP
UTE TRIBAL 5-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333740 17306 Indian W OPS
UTE TRIBAL 7-32D-55 050S 050W 301333794 18359 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 12-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301333798 18360 Indian
FOY 9-33D-55 33 050S 050W 4301333802 17125 Fee OW OPS
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UTE TRIBAL 13-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333807 18378 Indian OW OPS
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333887 18594 Indian OW OPS
LC FEE 8-15D-56 15 050S 060W 4301350597 19347 Fee OW OPS
SFW FEE 13-10D-54 10 050S 301350892 19186 Fee W OPS
SFW TRIBAL l l-10D-54 10 1350893 19215 Indian OW S
LC TRIBAL SHH-5-56 4 050S 060W 4301350927 18463 Indian OW OPS
LC TRIBAL 16-34D-45 W 01350977 18658 Indian S
LC TRIBAL 3-4D-56 4 OSOS 060W 4301351000 18852 Indian OW OPS
FEDERAL 7-12D-65 2 050W 18717 Federal W S
LC TRIBAL 2-33D-45 33 040S 050W 4301351402 18854 Indian OW OPS
LC TRIBAL 9-3D-56 060W 301351514 18948 OW S
LC Tribal 3-34D-56 34 OSOS 060W 4301352087 4 Bdian OW OPS
LC Triba17-34D-56 _ _ 050S W 301352088 9235 Indian OW OPS
Ute Tribal 5-9D-54 _ __ 050S 040W 301352463 19354 Indian OW OPS
Ute Tribal 3-9D-54 9 OSOS 040W 4301352464 19355 Indian OW OPS
BC UTE TRIBAL 4-22 i2 050S 040W 301330755 2620 Indian OW

Berry Petroleum Company, LLCN4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

LC Tribal 5-22D-57 22 OSOS 070W 4301352133 Indian OW NEWin:bb D 4 OW
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Federal 13-7D-65 7 60S 50W 4301352974 Federal OW NEW
Federal 14-7D-65 7_ 60S 50W 4301352975 ral ONW NEW
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LC FEE 15-36D-56 36 050S 060W 4301352983 Fee OW EW
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LC TRIBAL 2-35D-56 35 050S 060W 4301352988 Indian OW EW
LC TRIBAL 1-35D-56 35 OSOS 060W 4301352989 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 13-3R-54 3 050S 040W 4301330924 9488 ndian
UTE TRIBAL 3-20D-55 20 050S 050W 4301333280 18424 dian OW OPS
LC TRIBAL 4H-17-56 17 050S 060W 4301333540 18067 Indian OW OPS
LC TRIBAL 16-21-46 21 040S 060W 4301333575 16156 Indian W OPS
UTE TRIBAL 8-20D-55 20 OSOS 050W 4301333676 17308 ndian OW OPS
UTE TRIBAL 14-14D-55 050S 050W W OP
UTE TRIBAL 5-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333740 17306 Indian W OPS
UTE TRIBAL 7-32D-55 050S 050W 301333794 18359 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 12-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301333798 18360 Indian
FOY 9-33D-55 33 050S 050W 4301333802 17125 Fee OW OPS
BERRY TRIBAL 2-23D-54 iÏ 050S 040W 430Ï33380Ì18546 Indian W ŒS
UTE TRIBAL 13-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333807 18378 Indian OW OPS
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333887 18594 Indian OW OPS
LC FEE 8-15D-56 15 050S 060W 4301350597 19347 Fee OW OPS
SFW FEE 13-10D-54 10 050S 301350892 19186 Fee W OPS
SFW TRIBAL l l-10D-54 10 1350893 19215 Indian OW S
LC TRIBAL SHH-5-56 4 050S 060W 4301350927 18463 Indian OW OPS
LC TRIBAL 16-34D-45 W 01350977 18658 Indian S
LC TRIBAL 3-4D-56 4 OSOS 060W 4301351000 18852 Indian OW OPS
FEDERAL 7-12D-65 2 050W 18717 Federal W S
LC TRIBAL 2-33D-45 33 040S 050W 4301351402 18854 Indian OW OPS
LC TRIBAL 9-3D-56 060W 301351514 18948 OW S
LC Tribal 3-34D-56 34 OSOS 060W 4301352087 4 Bdian OW OPS
LC Triba17-34D-56 _ _ 050S W 301352088 9235 Indian OW OPS
Ute Tribal 5-9D-54 _ __ 050S 040W 301352463 19354 Indian OW OPS
Ute Tribal 3-9D-54 9 OSOS 040W 4301352464 19355 Indian OW OPS
BC UTE TRIBAL 4-22 i2 050S 040W 301330755 2620 Indian OW



Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115) 
Effective June 1, 2014 

B C UTE TRIBAL 16-16 __ +!§. 050S 1040W 4301330841 9489 Indian OW iP -1------------1 

B C UTE TRIBAL 14-15 _ _ _______ ~ 050S 040W 430133084219440 Indian 'OW 'p __ ' ___________ -1 

UTE TRIBAL 1-32R .. ________ . ~_ 050S 040W 4301330872 13020 Indian --~----t-------------------l 
UTE TRIBAL 23-3R ~-=-~ 050S 040W 4301330886 13034 :Indian OW P 
S COTTONWOOD RIDGE UTE TRIBAL 1-19 19 050S 040W 4301330933 9845 'Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON 
TABBY CYN UTE TRIBAL 1-25 ,25 050S _ 050W 4301330945 9722 Indian ___ --+O'::'.W~ __ ___+ .... p----+_----------

S BRUNDAGE UTE TRIBAL 1 3030 050S 040W 43013309489850 Indian OW P , 

~~n::EH?-~~~ -=! _. mi ill: 1m!!:: ~1l: :::: ~: r~ I-_:--=--==··~-_==.~~-=---_-,-,,-_-_-_-_.--l_ 
T C UTE TRIBAL 9-23X . __ ~ 050S 050W 4301330999 19720 Indian OW iP ;...1 __________ --j 

UTE TRIBAL 15-24R 24 050S 050W 4301331129 11985 Indian OW --1>-----1 . 
SBRUNDAGECYNUTETRIBAL~ 27 050S 040W 4301331131 9851 'Indian OW P =r---==--.-. 
~~}~JT~~}2~~t~-1~~==---~~-·-- ~~~i I~:~~ :~~!~~!~:! !~~H l:;i=g~ ~---=~AGECANYON--
~==~~~====~~~-------~~-~~~~=~~~~~~~~~=----~--~ 
UTE TRIBAL 13-19 ___ . ___ ~ 050S 040W 4301331284 11134 Indian ___ 10W_ P-----i-------.. ___ . __ 
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 7-25 25 ,050S _ 050W 4301331310 11416 Indian OW __ -+P ____ -+ _________ --I 
UTE TRIBAL 13-17 ----------,..!l...- 050S 040W 4301331546 11921 Indian OW -J----- BRUNDAGE CANYON 
UTE TRIBAL 11-19 .. ______ '19 050S 040W 4301331547 11920 Indian OW P __ 

~~~ ~~1~ ~~;i2 -.. - .-- -I;; -~:~~ :~: ;::~:::::: ::~~ ::::: ~: _. I~~' ------------
UTE TRIBAL 4-30 _____ . __ . ___ .. 30 __ 050S 040W 4301331550 11914 Indian OW 4---- ________ -1 

UTE TRIBAL 15-16 ,16 050S 040W 4301331648 11951 Indian OW P 
UTETRIBALI6-18 _~-_. :----.--=18--.050S !040W 4301331650 '11946 Indian . ~O~W __ ~ __ BRUNDAGECANYON 
UTE TRIBAL 5-20 . ..____ 20 '050S 040W 4301331651 11957 IIndian --- OW -J'-=-=t----- __ ._ 
UTE TRIBAL 15-23 __ .23 050S 050W 4301331671 ,11989 Indian OW __ J'.- __ _ ___ .. _ 
TABBY CANYON 1-21 --=--1'21= 050S 1050W 4301331699 12225 Indian OW P __ 

TABBY CANYON 8-22 ___ =-. 22 . <ll()o; OSOW- 4301331700 12008 I.dim lOW. r I .. =-. --
SOWERSCANYON9-27_______ 27 050S 050W 4301331701 11997 Indian OW _ P _ _ __ 
UTE TRIBAL 3-19 _.__ 19 _ 050S 040W 4301331830 12197 Indian OW _. P ._ 

~~i ~~:~ r~~!9==-.~ Ii: mi E~: :mmm :m~~: -I~: -. I~ - = I --.- -~ 
UTE TRIBAL 3-25 ________ 25 050S 050W 4301331834 12152 Indian OW __ P . ___ ._. _______ _ 

E§i~lg: ·~-l~r mi :m~~mmilil!m§I~~ I~ l-=-== 
~~=~::;:H .=-=-4i m~~E~: :mmm :l;~lE: .I~r t-~;.:::::::: 
:;::::; ~;: g:g= =--¥,- ~:~~ :~: ::~:::;::: :;;:; :~:: -I~: -~ I~ :~:;:~~: ~~~~ . 
.!:TIE TRIBAL 14-17 ____ ._._._. ___ .~17_. 050S 040W 4301332147 12755 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON 
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

BC UTE TRIBAL 16-16 050S 040W 43013308 Indian OW P
BC UTE TRIBAL 14-15 15 050S 040W 4301330842 9440 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-32R 050S 040W 4301330872 13020 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 23-3R 23 1050S 040W 4301330886 13034 Indian OW P
S COTTONWOOD RIDGE UTE TRIBAL 1-19 19 050S 040W 4301330933 9845 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
TÄBBY CYN UTE TRIBAL 1-25 25 050S 050W 4301330945 9722 Ind OW
S BRUNDAGE UTE TRIBAL 1-30 30 050S 040W 4301330948 9850 Indian OW P
SOWERSCYN UTE TRIBÃL 3-26 26 050S 050W 4301330955 10423 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-24R-55 (REENTRY) 24 050S 050W 4301330960 15173 Indian OW P
UBRIBAL 1-20 20 050S 040W 4301330966 9925 Indian OW P
TC UTE TRIBAL 9-23X 23 050S 050W 4301330999 \9720 Indian OW PU¯Ïž

TRIBAL 15-24R 24 OSOS 050W 4301331129 11985 Indian OW P
S BRUNDAGE CYN UTE TRIBAL 4-27 27 050S 040W 4301331131 9851 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-13 13 050S 050W 4301331152 10421 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-20R-54 20 050S 040W 4301331281 14088 Indian OW P
Z and T UTE TRIBÃL 7-19 050S 040W 43(0Ï331282|11131 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
U Ìž TRIBAL 13-19 19 050S 040W 4301331284 11134 Indian OW P

ancÏT UTE TRIBAL 7-3 050S 050W 4301331310 11416 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-17 17 050S 040W 4301331546 11921 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 11-19 19 050S 040W 4301331547 11920 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-22 22 050S 040W 4301331548 11926 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-28 28 050S 040W 4301331549 11925 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 4-30 30 050S 040W 4301331550 11914 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-16 16 050S 040W 4301331648 11951 Indian OW P
U TRIBAL 16-Ï8 18 050S 040W 4301331650 11946 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 5-20 20 050S_ 040W 4301331651 11957 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-23 23 050S 050W 4301331671 11989 Indian W P
TABBY CANYON 1-21 21 050S 050W 4301331699 12225 Indian W P
TABBY CANYON 8-22 22 050S 050W 4301331700 12008 Indian OW P
SOWERS CANYON 9-27 27 050S 050W 4301331701 11997 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 3-19 19 050S 040W 4301331830 12197 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-19 19 050S 040W 4301331831 12175 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 15-19 19 050S 040W 4301331832 12180 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-25 25 050S 050W 4301331833 12153 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 3-25 25 050S 050W 4301331834 12152 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-24 24 050S 050W 4301331909 12190 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-24 24 050S 050W 4301331910 12217 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-25 25 050S 050W 4301331911 12182 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-26 26 050S 050W 4301331912 12235 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-19 19 050S 040W 4301332140 12795 Indian OW P RUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 6-25H 050W 4301332143 Ì2750Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-18 18 050S 040W 4301332144 12746 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 11-17 17 040W 4301332145 12747 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 12-17 17 050S 040W 4301332146 12745 Indian P UNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 14-17 050S 04 12755 Indian OW P RUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 15-18 18 050S 040W 4301332148 12794 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 6-22 2 050S 040W 4301332163 12974 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-21 21 050S 040W 4301332164 12994 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-28 28 050S 040W 4301332166 12995 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-20 20 050S 040W 4301332168 12946 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-25 25 050S 050W 4301332169 12857 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-27 27 050S 040W 43 IndÍan OW
UTE TRIBAL 1-33 33 050S 040W 301332185 13024 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-34 4 050S 040W 4301332186 13121 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-35 5 050S 050W 4301332187 13021 Indian ONW
UTE TRIBAL 4-36 36 050S 050W 4301332188 13063 Indian OW P
UTE TRI AL 5-28_ 8 050S 040W 4301332189 13026 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-31 31 050S 040W 4301332190 13080 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-26 05 4301332191 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-28 28 050S 040W 4301332192 13022 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-29 29 050S 040W 4301332193 13042 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-19 050S 040W 4301332204 13090 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 12-15 15 OSOS 040W 4301332205 13100 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-20 20 050S 040W 4301332206 13048 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-24-55 24 1050S 50W [4301332259 13618 Indian \OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-28-54 28 050S 40W W0133226113644 Indian P
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115) 
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UTE TRIBAL 5-24-55~~____ 24 050S 050W 4301332263 13621.Indian OW P _______ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 5-26-55 26 050S 050W 4301332264 13642 Indian OW P 

-------- ---------

UTE TRIBAL 6-36-55 36 050S '050W 4301332265 13600 Indian OW P ____ l~----
UTE TRIBAL 9-24-55 _------'24-- 050S 050W 4301332268 ,13620 Indian OW P ~-t '--= -~--~= 
UTE TRIBAL 11-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301332269 13572 .Indian OW IP 

~i~ i~:1~ ~~~~~~~~ -----. .. i :;:~ :::~ ::::::;;~ ::;~:::- ,LL-- ~~==---~~ 
UTE TRIBAL 15-27--55-- ---===-~ 27_ 050S 050W 4301332339 ,14020 Indian OW P' __ 
UTE TRIBAL 5-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332344 13606 Indian OWP _ _ __ 
UTE TRIBAL 7-20-55 ----- 20~ _ 050W 4301332346 13607 ,Indian OW ;P 

MOON TRIBAL 12-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332347 14008 Indian OW P_ 
UTE TRIBAL 14-28-55-----

d 

- 128 _ 050S 050W 4301332348 13580 Indian -- OW P_ _ ____ ~ ____ ~ 
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-55 =f;2

l
9= 050S '050W 4301332349 '13581 Indian OW P ------i-----_~ _____ _ 

UTE TRIBAL 2-32-55--- ------~ 32 - _ 050W 4301332350 13695 Indian OW P ! 

~i~ i~:1~ ~~~~~~~~- _-~ _-~--- _ ~~_ -:~~~~ ~~~: i:~~~~~~~~; ~~~:~ ~:~::--%--O:W - I~.- 1 .. -------------:-
UTE TRIBAL 12-36-55 ,36 050S ,050W 4301332354 13643 Indian ----r----~--------
UTE TRIBAL 14-36-55 _ - ---. M .. '05OS '050W 4301332355 14262 IndiM OW P , 
UTE TRIBAL 16-36-55 ________ ~ __ 36_~ ~_ 050W'4301332356 14122.Indian OW----+p- r -- -------
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-55 33 050S 050W 4301332357 13685 Indian OW-- Jf ~--- ----- ------
~ =~ :i:::::; ~- 1::_ ::: ,::~ ::::::;::: ::::~ :~:: ..:~ I; ... I --
UTE TRIBAL 3-20-54 20 050S '040W 4301332377 ,13955 Indian OW P 'BRUNDAGE CANYON 
UTE TRIBAL 4-21-54 -~--=-=-=-~ -21_- 050S 040W 4301332378 13907 Indian 'OW -- P ~--1 -- --- .:-~ 
UTE TRIBAL 9-20-54 __________ 20 ,050S 040W '4301332379 13906 ,Indian OW ~___ _ _______ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 5-30-54 ,30 050S 040W 4301332380 13905 Indian OW P - ---_.,----- --
UTE TRIBAL 16-21-54 121 050S 040W 4301332381 13912 Indian OW P BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0 
UTE TRIBAL 15-30-54 --- --~~ 0s0S 040W 4301332382 13944 Indian OW -~~~---r- - -
UTE TRIBAL 9-30-54 _ ---==-W,>---~ 'OSOS 040W 4301332383 14050 IIndian OW P I -------
UTE TRIBAL 14-21-54 _____ ~ 050S 040W 4301332384 13946 Indian OW =-t--=r----~-- -------
~i~i~:1~~~---- =f.-=- :::~ ~:~ ::::;;;;:!:;~: ::::: -I~~ I}-l -==---
:3E~~~!~~:-~=- -I~! ··~m ili~ ~mmml1§ g~~~r~f~ -, ~n - -= 
MOON TRIBAL 6-27-54 ____ 27 _ ,050S 040W 4301332407 13969 Indian OW - ~-=--~-__ --=-~~_--= 
MOON TRIBAL 14-27-54 _________ ~ 050S 040W 4301332408 13998 Indian ~-1=-----=--r=-----------
UTE TRIBAL 3-32-54 _ _ _______ - _132 050S i040W 4301332410 13949 Indian __ ~_ P _~ __ ~ ___ ~ __ 
UTE TRIBAL 7-32-54 __________ 32 ___ ,050S 040W'4301332411 13936.Indian 'OW -- P ~--E----------
UTE TRIBAL 7-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332413 13945 !Indian OW P 

~i~ i~:1~ ~~;;~;~5- =~-==±- ~~~~ i~~~: :;~~;~~:~~~~~:~ ~:~:: --~ I: . =.:... .:.: 
UTE TRIBAL 3-27-55 --=--=-_ -----m-27~ 050S 050W 14301332417 14022 .Indian =it-OW - P - l- ----=---.---=--=-=-____ _ 
~TRIBAL 7-27-55 27 050S 050W 4301332418 13948 Indian OW 1 
UTE TIUBALW-28-55 -- -----=----~ 050S 050W 4301332419 14580 Indian --==- OW --=- P_ --=-_ ~_~=_--==----=-
UTE TRIBAL 6-32-55 __ _ ___ ~ 050S 050W 4301332420 14895 ,Indian • ji~W~ P ~ ___ +_- _~ __ ~ __ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 8-32-55 ___ ~ __ JL_---tosOS 050W 4301332421 14896 iIndian OW _ P _~-+ ___ ~_ ~ _ ~_ 
UTE TRIBAL 2-36-55 __ _______ t6 050S050W 4301332422 :13937 Indian OW ---n> I __ 
QThTRIBAL 8-36-55 _ __ 36 050S 050W 4301332423 14021 IIndian OW --7 
UTE TRIBAL 13-16-54~ ___ ~ _~ __ 050S 040~S01332511 13981 Indian j~iW= --~ ____ =---=-~-=-I-=-=_-= __ _ 
~TRIBAL 13-23-55 _____ ~ _ ,23 050S 050W 4301332513 13975 Indian __ OW - r _ -T- ________ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 7-23-2_5 _________ -ill ~_ ~_ 050W 4301332514 13976 Indian OW _ P ~_~ _~ ____ ~ ___ ~ 
UTE TRIBAL 5-33-54_ ____ __ 3J 050S 040W 4301332521 14060 'lndiM i~r. ,p_ -=J:=-~ __ __ _ __ _ 
JT.TE TRIBAL 11-33-54 _ 33 -1050s J>40W 4301332522 14061 iIndian OW 'P __ +--
UTE TRIBAL 14-32-54 - - _-=-~ _= ~--G2-= --=lli0Sj04OW 4301332523 114062_~~= - OW--- ji-:.. ~~_ -~~ ---= 
UTE TRIBAl,- 1-23~ ~ ____ ~ ___ £_3 _ '050S 050W 4301332524 14044 Indian _ lOW P-- -t- _ _~_ 
UTE TRIBAL 5-29-5429 050S 1040W 4301332525 14045 Indian OW ip- - _-

~i~ i~:1~ !~;~~~:~~ -=~~-~--m --i'::: t:~ ::::::;:;: ::::,:::: I~~ --Jt:""i =-=--=--.:.. . 
UTETRIBAL7-3W4-- -- - -- --- ill -- 050S 1040W 4301332528 114i60 Indi~ ~ OW - ~ -- - ,-- - - ------

~t~f~:t~i~~!~~~4 -~~_-~~--~~_=--I;~_ -10~~~ @§~~~~~;~~;~ill~~j~~:: ~~-= :g:=~-i-== -! ---=-~--=-=-
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

UTE TRIBAL 5-24-55 24 OSOS 050W 4301332263 13621 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-26-55 26 050S 050W 4301332264 13642 Indian OW P
UE TRIBAL 6-36-55 _ 36 050S 050W 4301332265 13600 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-24-55 24 OSOS 050W 4301332268 13620 Man OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301332269 13572 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-25-55 E 050S 050W 4301332271 13566 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-14-55 14 050S_050W 4301332272 13567 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-27-55 27 m 050W 4301332339 14020 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-15-55 15 OSOS 050W 4301332344 13606 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-20-55 20 OSOS 050W 4301332346 13607 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 12-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332347 14008 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-28-55 28 050S 050W 4301332348 13580 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-55 29 050S 050W 4301332349 13581 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 2-32-55 32 050S 050W 4301332350 13695 Indian OW P
I TE TRIBAL 16-35-55 35 050S 050W (4301332352 14267 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-35-55 35 050S 050W 4301332353 13645 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332354 13643 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332355 14262 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-36-55 36 050S 050W 64301332356 14122 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-55 33 050S 050W 4301332357 13685 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 15-17-55 17 050S 050W 4301332358 13698 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-14-54 050S 040W 4301332369 13647 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332377 13955 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 4-21-54 21 OSOS 040W 4301332378 13907 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-20-54 20 OSOS 040W 4301332379 3906 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 5-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332380 13905 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301332381 13912 India W P BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 15-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332382 13944 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-30-54 30 OSOS 040W 4301332383 14050 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301332384 13946 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 12-21-54 2 050S 040W 4301332385 13928 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 15-20-54 20 OSOS 040W 4301332386 13911 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-28-54 28 040W 4301332387 13908 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-28-54 28 050S_ 040W 4301332388 13910 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-28-54 28 040W 4301332389 13909 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332390 13715 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 6-27-54 27 050S_ 040W 4301332407 13969 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 14-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332408 13998 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 3-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332410 13949 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 7-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332411 13936 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 7-33-54 33 040W 4301332413 13945 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 11-20-55 20 050S 050W 4301332415 14269 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-27-55 27 050S 050W 4301332416 13947 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-27-55 27 050S 050W 4301332417 14022 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-27-55 27 050S 050W 4301332418 13948 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-28-55 ÏÏÌ0S 050W 4301332419 14580 Indian ÒW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-32-55 050S 050W 4301332420 14895 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-32-55 32 050S 050W 4301332421 14896 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-36-55 36 05 4301332422 13937 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332423 14021 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 13-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301332511 13981 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301332513 13975 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-23-55 4301332514 13976 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 5-33-54 33 OSOS 040W 4301332521 14060 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332522 14061 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332523 14062 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301332524 14044 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332525 14045 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-31-54 050 4301332526 14116 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-31-54 31 050S 4301332527 14109 Man OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332528 14160 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332529 14177 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332530 14163 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-23-55 23 050S 050W 36 14077 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-23-55 23 050S 50W 4301332537 14108 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-32-54 32 050S 40W 4301332538 1419 ndian OW P
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

UTE TRIBAL 5-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332539 14112 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 10-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332540 14195 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 12-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332541 14161 lIndian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 8-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332543 14139 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332549 14162 Indian OW P
WILLIAMSON TRIBAL 3-34-54 34 050S 040W 4301332550 14222 Indian OW P
WII LIAMSON TRIBAL 5-34-54 34 _ 050S 040W 4301332551 14235 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 6-2-65 2 060S 050W 4301332557 14655 Federal OW P
ÜÌE TRIBAL 15-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332561 14316 Indian OW P
ÜÌl TRIBAL 7-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332562 14354 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332563 14337 IIndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332564 14315 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-29-54 OSOS 040W 4301332565 14367 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332566 14369 Indian OW P
ÜÌI TRIBAL 1-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332567 14266 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-54 13 050S 040W 4301332568 14281 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332570 14299 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301332571 14388 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-29-54 29 OSOS 040W 4301332572 14336 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332573 14247 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301332586 15270 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301332587 14194 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301332588 14311 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301332589 14178 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-22-54 22 050S 040W 14219 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332591 14328 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-22-54 22 OSOS 040W 4301332592 14218 India P
UTE TRIBAL 14-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332593 14220 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-13-55 13 050S 050W 4301332599 15134 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-55 14 050S 050W 4301332600 14236 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332602 14263 Indian OW_ P
UTE TRIBAL 10-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301332603 14385 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332604 14268 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332605 14298 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332606 14330 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332607 14329 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-27-55 27 050S 050W 4301332614 14881 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-27-55 27 050S 050W 4301332615 14882 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332616 14370 OW P
UK TRIBAL 15-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332617 14921 ÌndÏan OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332620 14365 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332621 14518 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 6-20-54 20 OSOS 040W 4301332622 14382 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYOTÌ
UTE TRIBAL 5-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332624 14547 Indian OW P
ÜTE TRIBAL 3-30-54 30 040W 4301332625 1436LIndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-10-54 10 050S 040W 4301332663 14414 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-5-54 5 050S 4301332664 14415 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332666 14460 Indian OW _ P
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-55 31 050S 050W 4301332673 14407 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332675 14656 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-30-55 30 050S 050W 4301332680 14427 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-17-54 17 050S 040W 4301332687 15309 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-31-54 31 OSOS 040W 4301332688 14517 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-19-54 050S 40W 4301332690 14546 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332691 14491 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-32-54 32 50S 040W 4301332N4490Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 11-14-55 14 50S 050W 4301332693 15136 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 28 050S 050W 4301332694 14574 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 6-1-65 1 060S 050W 4301332699 15776 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332701 14573 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-20-54 20 m 04 1332702 14459 Indian OW P
#1 DLB 12-15-56 15 050S 060W 4301332710 14943 Fee GW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332716 14627 an
UT A 19-5i 9 4301332717 146 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 16-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332718 14604 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-12-55 12 OSOS 050W 4301332721 14605 Indian OW P

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
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UTE TRIBAL 5-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332539 14112 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 10-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332540 14195 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 12-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332541 14161 lIndian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 8-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332543 14139 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332549 14162 Indian OW P
WILLIAMSON TRIBAL 3-34-54 34 050S 040W 4301332550 14222 Indian OW P
WII LIAMSON TRIBAL 5-34-54 34 _ 050S 040W 4301332551 14235 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 6-2-65 2 060S 050W 4301332557 14655 Federal OW P
ÜÌE TRIBAL 15-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332561 14316 Indian OW P
ÜÌl TRIBAL 7-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332562 14354 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332563 14337 IIndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332564 14315 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-29-54 OSOS 040W 4301332565 14367 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332566 14369 Indian OW P
ÜÌI TRIBAL 1-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332567 14266 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-54 13 050S 040W 4301332568 14281 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332570 14299 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301332571 14388 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-29-54 29 OSOS 040W 4301332572 14336 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332573 14247 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301332586 15270 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301332587 14194 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301332588 14311 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301332589 14178 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-22-54 22 050S 040W 14219 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332591 14328 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-22-54 22 OSOS 040W 4301332592 14218 India P
UTE TRIBAL 14-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332593 14220 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-13-55 13 050S 050W 4301332599 15134 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-55 14 050S 050W 4301332600 14236 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332602 14263 Indian OW_ P
UTE TRIBAL 10-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301332603 14385 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332604 14268 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332605 14298 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332606 14330 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332607 14329 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-27-55 27 050S 050W 4301332614 14881 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-27-55 27 050S 050W 4301332615 14882 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332616 14370 OW P
UK TRIBAL 15-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332617 14921 ÌndÏan OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332620 14365 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332621 14518 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 6-20-54 20 OSOS 040W 4301332622 14382 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYOTÌ
UTE TRIBAL 5-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332624 14547 Indian OW P
ÜTE TRIBAL 3-30-54 30 040W 4301332625 1436LIndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-10-54 10 050S 040W 4301332663 14414 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-5-54 5 050S 4301332664 14415 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332666 14460 Indian OW _ P
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-55 31 050S 050W 4301332673 14407 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332675 14656 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-30-55 30 050S 050W 4301332680 14427 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-17-54 17 050S 040W 4301332687 15309 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-31-54 31 OSOS 040W 4301332688 14517 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-19-54 050S 40W 4301332690 14546 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332691 14491 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-32-54 32 50S 040W 4301332N4490Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 11-14-55 14 50S 050W 4301332693 15136 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 28 050S 050W 4301332694 14574 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 6-1-65 1 060S 050W 4301332699 15776 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332701 14573 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-20-54 20 m 04 1332702 14459 Indian OW P
#1 DLB 12-15-56 15 050S 060W 4301332710 14943 Fee GW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332716 14627 an
UT A 19-5i 9 4301332717 146 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 16-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332718 14604 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-12-55 12 OSOS 050W 4301332721 14605 Indian OW P

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
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UTE TRIBAL 5-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332539 14112 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 10-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332540 14195 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 12-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332541 14161 lIndian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 8-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332543 14139 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332549 14162 Indian OW P
WILLIAMSON TRIBAL 3-34-54 34 050S 040W 4301332550 14222 Indian OW P
WII LIAMSON TRIBAL 5-34-54 34 _ 050S 040W 4301332551 14235 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 6-2-65 2 060S 050W 4301332557 14655 Federal OW P
ÜÌE TRIBAL 15-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332561 14316 Indian OW P
ÜÌl TRIBAL 7-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332562 14354 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332563 14337 IIndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332564 14315 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-29-54 OSOS 040W 4301332565 14367 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301332566 14369 Indian OW P
ÜÌI TRIBAL 1-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332567 14266 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-54 13 050S 040W 4301332568 14281 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332570 14299 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301332571 14388 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-29-54 29 OSOS 040W 4301332572 14336 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332573 14247 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301332586 15270 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301332587 14194 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301332588 14311 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301332589 14178 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-22-54 22 050S 040W 14219 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332591 14328 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-22-54 22 OSOS 040W 4301332592 14218 India P
UTE TRIBAL 14-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332593 14220 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-13-55 13 050S 050W 4301332599 15134 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-55 14 050S 050W 4301332600 14236 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332602 14263 Indian OW_ P
UTE TRIBAL 10-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301332603 14385 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332604 14268 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332605 14298 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332606 14330 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332607 14329 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-27-55 27 050S 050W 4301332614 14881 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-27-55 27 050S 050W 4301332615 14882 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332616 14370 OW P
UK TRIBAL 15-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301332617 14921 ÌndÏan OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332620 14365 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332621 14518 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 6-20-54 20 OSOS 040W 4301332622 14382 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYOTÌ
UTE TRIBAL 5-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332624 14547 Indian OW P
ÜTE TRIBAL 3-30-54 30 040W 4301332625 1436LIndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-10-54 10 050S 040W 4301332663 14414 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-5-54 5 050S 4301332664 14415 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332666 14460 Indian OW _ P
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-55 31 050S 050W 4301332673 14407 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332675 14656 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-30-55 30 050S 050W 4301332680 14427 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-17-54 17 050S 040W 4301332687 15309 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-31-54 31 OSOS 040W 4301332688 14517 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-19-54 050S 40W 4301332690 14546 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332691 14491 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-32-54 32 50S 040W 4301332N4490Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 11-14-55 14 50S 050W 4301332693 15136 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 28 050S 050W 4301332694 14574 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 6-1-65 1 060S 050W 4301332699 15776 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332701 14573 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-20-54 20 m 04 1332702 14459 Indian OW P
#1 DLB 12-15-56 15 050S 060W 4301332710 14943 Fee GW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332716 14627 an
UT A 19-5i 9 4301332717 146 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 16-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332718 14604 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-12-55 12 OSOS 050W 4301332721 14605 Indian OW P
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

NIELSEN MARSING 13-14-56 14 050S 060W 4301332737 15060 Fee OW P
TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 22 050S 060W 4301332738 15058 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332739 14671 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332740 14691 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332741 14672 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332742 14736 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332743 14690 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-30-54 30 OSOS 040W 4301332746 15583 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332749 14758 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332750 14798 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332751 14842 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-16-55 16 050S 050W 4301332757 14865 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301332758 15112 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-55 25 OSOS 050W 4301332759 14821 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332760 14822 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332761 15661 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332762 14845 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332763 14723 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332764 14722 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332765 14701 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332766 14777 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332767 14494 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332768 15210 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332769 14799 Indian OW _ P
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332775 14762 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-54 25 050S 040W 4301332776 14753 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-54 _ E _ 050S 040W 4301332780 15280 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332781 15535 Indian OW P
MYRIN TRIBAL 14-19-55 19 050S 050W 4301332782 15184 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-30-55 30 _ 050S 050W 4301332783 15163 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 4-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332800 14985 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 5-27-54 27 040W 4301332802 14984 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332803 15151 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332804 15185 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332805 15485 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-35-54 35 OSOS 040W 4301332806 15292 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332807 15317 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332840 14946 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 13-20-55 20 050S 050W 4301332841 15097 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-22-54 22 OSOS 040W 4301332842 15015 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 6-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332843 15113 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-26-54 26 050S 040W 4301332844 15233 Indian OW !P
MOON TRIBAL 11-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332845 15135 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 15-27-54 27 050S 040W i4301332846 15115 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332847 14956 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 6-15-54 15 OS 040W 4301332848 16656 Indian ÒW P
ST TRIBAL 2-15-54 15 4301332849 16959 ian OW P
ST TRIBAL 4-15-54 15 OSOS 040W 4301332850 17478 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 8-15-54 15 OSOS 040W 4301332851 16279 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 25 05 4301332856 15430 Indian W T
UTE TRIBAL 3-30-55 30 050S 050W 4301332862 15340 Indian OW IP
UTE TRIBAL 7-19-55 19 050S 050W 4301332863 15279 Indian OW P

-19-55 S 050W 4301332864 15241 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 6-19-54 9 05O40W 4301332865 14947 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-54 50S 04Ñ 4301332866 14924 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-54 OS 04Ñ 4301332867 15554 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-26-54 26 050S 040W 4301332868 15231 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332869 14970 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-32-54 M OSOS 040W 301332870 15152 India P
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332871 15040 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-33-54 33 040W 01332872 l¾ Indian NW
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-54 22 MOS 040W 889 15607 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-26-54 26 050S 040W 4301332890 15268 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-26-54 26 040W 4301332891 15287 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 6-28D-54 28 050S 040W 4301332892 15232 Indian OW P
UTI niÌBÃI 0D 54 |30 050S 040W 430E332895298 Indian W

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

NIELSEN MARSING 13-14-56 14 050S 060W 4301332737 15060 Fee OW P
TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 22 050S 060W 4301332738 15058 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332739 14671 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332740 14691 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332741 14672 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332742 14736 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332743 14690 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-30-54 30 OSOS 040W 4301332746 15583 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332749 14758 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332750 14798 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332751 14842 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-16-55 16 050S 050W 4301332757 14865 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301332758 15112 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-55 25 OSOS 050W 4301332759 14821 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332760 14822 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332761 15661 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332762 14845 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332763 14723 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332764 14722 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332765 14701 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332766 14777 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332767 14494 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332768 15210 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332769 14799 Indian OW _ P
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332775 14762 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-54 25 050S 040W 4301332776 14753 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-54 _ E _ 050S 040W 4301332780 15280 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332781 15535 Indian OW P
MYRIN TRIBAL 14-19-55 19 050S 050W 4301332782 15184 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-30-55 30 _ 050S 050W 4301332783 15163 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 4-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332800 14985 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 5-27-54 27 040W 4301332802 14984 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332803 15151 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332804 15185 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332805 15485 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-35-54 35 OSOS 040W 4301332806 15292 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332807 15317 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332840 14946 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 13-20-55 20 050S 050W 4301332841 15097 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-22-54 22 OSOS 040W 4301332842 15015 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 6-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332843 15113 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-26-54 26 050S 040W 4301332844 15233 Indian OW !P
MOON TRIBAL 11-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332845 15135 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 15-27-54 27 050S 040W i4301332846 15115 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332847 14956 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 6-15-54 15 OS 040W 4301332848 16656 Indian ÒW P
ST TRIBAL 2-15-54 15 4301332849 16959 ian OW P
ST TRIBAL 4-15-54 15 OSOS 040W 4301332850 17478 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 8-15-54 15 OSOS 040W 4301332851 16279 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 25 05 4301332856 15430 Indian W T
UTE TRIBAL 3-30-55 30 050S 050W 4301332862 15340 Indian OW IP
UTE TRIBAL 7-19-55 19 050S 050W 4301332863 15279 Indian OW P

-19-55 S 050W 4301332864 15241 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 6-19-54 9 05O40W 4301332865 14947 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-54 50S 04Ñ 4301332866 14924 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-54 OS 04Ñ 4301332867 15554 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-26-54 26 050S 040W 4301332868 15231 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332869 14970 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-32-54 M OSOS 040W 301332870 15152 India P
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332871 15040 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-33-54 33 040W 01332872 l¾ Indian NW
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-54 22 MOS 040W 889 15607 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-26-54 26 050S 040W 4301332890 15268 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-26-54 26 040W 4301332891 15287 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 6-28D-54 28 050S 040W 4301332892 15232 Indian OW P
UTI niÌBÃI 0D 54 |30 050S 040W 430E332895298 Indian W

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

NIELSEN MARSING 13-14-56 14 050S 060W 4301332737 15060 Fee OW P
TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 22 050S 060W 4301332738 15058 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332739 14671 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332740 14691 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332741 14672 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332742 14736 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332743 14690 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-30-54 30 OSOS 040W 4301332746 15583 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332749 14758 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332750 14798 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332751 14842 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-16-55 16 050S 050W 4301332757 14865 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301332758 15112 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-55 25 OSOS 050W 4301332759 14821 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332760 14822 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301332761 15661 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332762 14845 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332763 14723 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332764 14722 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332765 14701 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301332766 14777 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332767 14494 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332768 15210 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332769 14799 Indian OW _ P
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332775 14762 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-54 25 050S 040W 4301332776 14753 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-54 _ E _ 050S 040W 4301332780 15280 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332781 15535 Indian OW P
MYRIN TRIBAL 14-19-55 19 050S 050W 4301332782 15184 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-30-55 30 _ 050S 050W 4301332783 15163 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 4-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332800 14985 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 5-27-54 27 040W 4301332802 14984 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332803 15151 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332804 15185 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332805 15485 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-35-54 35 OSOS 040W 4301332806 15292 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332807 15317 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332840 14946 Indian OW P BRUNDAGE CANYON
UTE TRIBAL 13-20-55 20 050S 050W 4301332841 15097 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-22-54 22 OSOS 040W 4301332842 15015 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 6-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332843 15113 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-26-54 26 050S 040W 4301332844 15233 Indian OW !P
MOON TRIBAL 11-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332845 15135 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 15-27-54 27 050S 040W i4301332846 15115 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332847 14956 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 6-15-54 15 OS 040W 4301332848 16656 Indian ÒW P
ST TRIBAL 2-15-54 15 4301332849 16959 ian OW P
ST TRIBAL 4-15-54 15 OSOS 040W 4301332850 17478 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 8-15-54 15 OSOS 040W 4301332851 16279 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 25 05 4301332856 15430 Indian W T
UTE TRIBAL 3-30-55 30 050S 050W 4301332862 15340 Indian OW IP
UTE TRIBAL 7-19-55 19 050S 050W 4301332863 15279 Indian OW P

-19-55 S 050W 4301332864 15241 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 6-19-54 9 05O40W 4301332865 14947 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-54 50S 04Ñ 4301332866 14924 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-54 OS 04Ñ 4301332867 15554 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-26-54 26 050S 040W 4301332868 15231 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301332869 14970 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-32-54 M OSOS 040W 301332870 15152 India P
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332871 15040 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-33-54 33 040W 01332872 l¾ Indian NW
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-54 22 MOS 040W 889 15607 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-26-54 26 050S 040W 4301332890 15268 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-26-54 26 040W 4301332891 15287 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 6-28D-54 28 050S 040W 4301332892 15232 Indian OW P
UTI niÌBÃI 0D 54 |30 050S 040W 430E332895298 Indian W



UTE TRIBAL 4-32-54 
UTE TRIBAL 6-32D-54 
UTE TRIBAL 2-33D-54 
UTE TRIBAL 12-32-54 
UTE TRIBAL 16-32D-54 

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc, (N4115) 
Effective June 1, 2014 

--rR--
32 

-------
050S 040W 4301332896 15555 Indian OW _~_ 
050S 040W 4301332897 15312 Indian OW 'P --f-----~~---~-.-

33 
32 
32 

050S 040W 4301332898 15271 Indian OWt. ______________________ _ 
050S i040W 4301332925 15503 Indian OW P -! __________ _ 

_-+0=5..:::0S=-_ 040W 4301332926 16971 Indian OW P --------+----- --_.- -------- -_ .. _-
MOON TRIBAL 16-23-54 23 
UTE TRIBAL 4-25-55 25 
~='-'--'~~~"--"-"'--"'::'......------F----I-"'0 .... 50 .... S'_+0-..:4.:c..OW_'_'__I-"43"'0'":1 .... 33~2~9~27':_+1 ... 5:-""2~19'---FIn .... d"_'ian=_ __ _+IO=W_:_-___t::Pc__.------l---- ______ _ 

050S 050W.4301332928 15421 Indian ,OW P ______________________ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 7-36-55 36 
MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 2 
UTE TRIBAL 10-24-54 24 

-" 

050S 050W 4301332929 15341 Indian IOW___ IPp _ ______ _ _______ _ 
~=~==-==----"-""c-=--:----------F_--J-=0-=-50=S 040W 4301332931 !15429 Indian OW _j-----_ --------------1 

050S 040W 4301332932 '15364 Indian OWP _ ~ _ _ __ 
MYRIN TRIBAL 16-19-55 19 
UTE TRIBAL 2-31-55 31 

050S 050W 4301332934 15339 Indian OW~_ _ ___________ _ 
050S 050W 4301332935 15428 Indian OW P __________ _ 

UTE TRIBAL 10-31-55 _. _______ ..........Q! 050S050W 4301332936 15354 Indian OW __ -=-P---- --+-___ ~ 
MOON TRIBAL 1-27-54 '27 050S 040W 4301332937 15308 'Indian OW P ____ +-_______________ ~ 

--------

MOON TRIBAL 5-23-54 ____ ~_ 23 ___ ~ 040W 4301332938 15584 Indian ,OW P _ -1---- __________ _ 
ST TRIBAL 7-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301332952 i 15724 Indian [OW P __ .. ___________ -1 

ST TRIBAL 5-18-54 _ 18_ 050S 040W 4301332953 15781 Indian OW ip .... u ________ ~_---1 
UTE TRIBAL 15-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301332971 15310 Indian _ __ 2'!L___ IP __ +---____ _ ___ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 4-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332972 15382 Indian OW 'P _ __ __ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 120 050S 040W 4301332973 15245Indian __ ~ __ t...-_ ---+-------------1 

UTE TRIBAL 2-20-54 _____ ~-- 050S 040W 4301332974 15269 !Indian OW_ P _~-+--___ ____ . ___ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 7-15-5515 050S 050W 4301332976 15311 'Indian OW --t-- _______ ---1 

UTE TRIBAL 10-15-55 15 050S 050W 14301332977 15380 Indian ,OW __ t..__ __ ......:....__ ____ _ ____ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 1-15-55 15 OSOS OSOW 430133297815299 Indim ,OW +"------ _[_ 
UTE TRIBAL 14-15-55 _~__ 15~~ 050W 4301332979 15369 Indian ~ow; ---l!'..-- _ _ ______ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-55 _____ 15 050S 050W 4301332980 15342 Indian _ OW _ IP __ _ _________ _ 

UTE TRIBAL 14-18-55 _ ____ _~ 050S '050W 4301332984 15671 Indian - OW •. t=----J..............-~ . __ 
UTE TRIBAL 14-24-56____ 24 050S 060W 4301332988 15740 Indian OW P I __ _ 

UTE TRIBAL 7-24-56 _ _ ___ 24 050S 060W 4301332989 15782 Indian _ lOW P __ -......L......-- __ -----1 

UTE TRIBAL 11-25-S6 25 OSOS O6OW 4301332990 15627 lrulim - IOW- ,P ._-t -----~_.--
UTE TRIBAL 7-25-56 ___________ ~ 050S 060W 4301332991 15617 Indian OW IP __ _ __ _ ___ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 5-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301332992 15648 Indian _ OW __ -J-- _ _ _______ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 3-25-5625 050S 060W 4301332993 15561 Indian OW _ -J--- __ + _________ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 13-15D-54 ~--U-- 050S 040W 4301333039 15368 Indian lOW P ----J..........-----.---__ 
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 _~ ______ ~~_ 050S 040W 4301333041 15377 Indian_~ ____ t--- __ ~ ___ ~ _______ ~ 
UTE TRIBAL 14-3ID-54 ___ 31 OSOS 040W 4301333042 "'419 I.dim ~ ,P - t-----
UTE TRIBAL 4-22-55 __ _ ~ 050S 050W 4301333044 15381 Indian OW :p _ _ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 2-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301333045 15416 Indian OW -------p---- ~-- ------ -------

-.----~--- ---t---- ----------
UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 ________ . ..81-- 050S050W 4301333046 15211 IIndian OW P 
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-55 _____ ~5 = 050S 050W 4301333047 15378 Indian OW P----..r---=---==---_ ___=_ 
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-55 ______________ 35 _ 050S 050W 4301333048115367 ~_ ,OW ___ P I ~ ____ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 15-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301333049 15379 Indian ---mt i5\\! _Ip--_= ~~ ____ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 10-12-55_ -.-------....JL 050S 050W 4301333055 15618 Indian OW =tp. __ + __ ___ __ 
~TE TRIBAL 5-13-54 t3 050S 040W 4301333075 15873 Indian OW _ P _____ -"---- ________ _ 
~TRIBAL 16-29-54 ___ . ____ 29 .~ 040W 4301333076 ,17074 Indian __ ..;QW -- P - ---1. __ _ ___ _ 
~;.: ~:~ ::;:8;:4 _==:::;:~ ~:~ ::::::::~ :;::: ::::: _I~~_ ( ~ __ -
UTE TRIBAL 12-33-5433 050S 040W 4301333090 15417 Indian OW P 

UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 _________ ~13!3 .. __ ~_ 040W 4301333091 15397 Indian --------l..OW- _ P _ ~_- ~ ~--=-=------=-------=: 
UTE TRIBAL 10-33-54 ____ . ______ ~ 33 _ i050S 040W 4301333092 15418 Indian __ OW~ ____ 1 __________ _ 

'~~ ~~ if:l!~l;=-==-=-I;; ~- '~l~i EH~;~~~;~~~~ I~r~ i-~f ~~~~ --~--; 
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-54 _______ = ~22 ~ 040W 4301333116 15662 Indian ~"Y: __ L-- --T __ _ ______ _ 

UTE TRIBAL 2-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301333117 15582 Indian OW If-- _ 
UTE TRIBAL 4-28-55 __ ._=_ =-=- 28 OSOS OSOW'4301333118 ISS06 l.d""'OW-=- :P--':- -1- ~ ~ __ 
~E[F:~E ;:~£6 __ --- -~: -_ ;,:l:~ :mm:~;:::E~F -~~ -~ I! -=, _ -=- -.-- --
WILCOXE~IASON7-15.---~ ______ j5 ~os 060W 4301333122 ,~~ _____ .....Qw.. ___ L _ __ -___ -___ = 
UTETRIBALI4-16-54__ ___ __ 16_~ _1050S ~1430133312~_.r!?612.J!ldian ~_ ~OW -Jf ~ ____ ~~~ _~ _____ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 1-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301333128 '15420 Indian lOW P 

~~~~£h---=------=-~-~-=--iiFfs~1~~~!;~ !~:~~ J~:~;:=-i§l-~---W--= ----=-~~-~ -~ 
13 
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UTE TRIBAL 4-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332896 15555 IIndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-32D-54 32 050S 040W 4301332897 15312 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-33D-54 33 050S 040W 4301332898 15271 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332925 15503 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-32D-54 32 050S 040W 4301332926 16971 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 16-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332927 15219 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332928 15421 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332929 15341 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 2 050S 040W 4301332931 15429 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332932 15364 Indian OW P
MYRIN TRIBAL 16-19-55 19 050S 050W 4301332934 15339 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-31-55 31 050S 050W 4301332935 15428 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-31-55 31 050S 050W 4301332936 15354 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 1-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332937 15308 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 5-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332938 15584 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 7-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301332952 15724 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 5-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301332953 15781 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301332971 15310 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332972 15382 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332973 15245 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332974 15269 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332976 15311 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 10-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332977 15380 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15-55 15 050S 050W [4301332978 15299 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-15-55 15 050S 050W |4301332979 15369 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332980 15342 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-18-55 18 050S 050W 4301332984 15671 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-24-56 24 050S 060W 4301332988 15740 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-24-56 24 OSOS 060W 4301332989 15782 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-56 25 050S _060W 4301332O5627Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 7-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301332991 15617 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301332992 15648 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301332993 15561 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333039 15368 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 28 050S 040W 4301333041 15377 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333042 15419 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301333044 15381 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301333045 15416 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301333046 15211 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-55 35 050S 050W 4301333047 15378 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-55 35 050S 050W 4301333048 15367 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301333049 15379 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-12-55 12 050S 050W 301333055 15618 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-13-54 13 050S 040W 301333075 15873 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-54 29 050S 040W 301333076 17074 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 12-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301333077 15575 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333089 15398 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333090 15417 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333091 15397 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333 15418 India OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-33-54 33 050S 040W 9 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333111 16832 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333112 15440 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333Ïl¾471Indi W P
UTE TRIBAL 11-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333Ìl515470 India OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301333116 15662 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301333Ï1715582 Indian oW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-28-55 28 050S 050W 4301333118 15506 Indian oW
UTE TRIBAL 8-29-55 29 050S 050W 4301333119 15507 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-29-55 29 050S 050W 4301333120 15504 Indian OW P
TAYLOR FEE 13-22-56 22 050S 060W 4301333121 15525 Fee OW P
WILCOX ELIASON 7-15-56 15 050S 060W 4301333122 15526 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-16-54 16 050S Ñ¾ŠÏ23 15639 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301333128 15420 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301333130 15455 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 16 050 40W 4301333131 15456 Indian OW P
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UTE TRIBAL 4-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332896 15555 IIndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-32D-54 32 050S 040W 4301332897 15312 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-33D-54 33 050S 040W 4301332898 15271 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332925 15503 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-32D-54 32 050S 040W 4301332926 16971 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 16-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332927 15219 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332928 15421 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332929 15341 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 2 050S 040W 4301332931 15429 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332932 15364 Indian OW P
MYRIN TRIBAL 16-19-55 19 050S 050W 4301332934 15339 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-31-55 31 050S 050W 4301332935 15428 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-31-55 31 050S 050W 4301332936 15354 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 1-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332937 15308 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 5-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332938 15584 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 7-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301332952 15724 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 5-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301332953 15781 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301332971 15310 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332972 15382 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332973 15245 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332974 15269 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332976 15311 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 10-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332977 15380 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15-55 15 050S 050W [4301332978 15299 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-15-55 15 050S 050W |4301332979 15369 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332980 15342 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-18-55 18 050S 050W 4301332984 15671 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-24-56 24 050S 060W 4301332988 15740 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-24-56 24 OSOS 060W 4301332989 15782 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-56 25 050S _060W 4301332O5627Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 7-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301332991 15617 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301332992 15648 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301332993 15561 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333039 15368 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 28 050S 040W 4301333041 15377 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333042 15419 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301333044 15381 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301333045 15416 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301333046 15211 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-55 35 050S 050W 4301333047 15378 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-55 35 050S 050W 4301333048 15367 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301333049 15379 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-12-55 12 050S 050W 301333055 15618 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-13-54 13 050S 040W 301333075 15873 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-54 29 050S 040W 301333076 17074 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 12-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301333077 15575 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333089 15398 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333090 15417 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333091 15397 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333 15418 India OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-33-54 33 050S 040W 9 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333111 16832 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333112 15440 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333Ïl¾471Indi W P
UTE TRIBAL 11-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333Ìl515470 India OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301333116 15662 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301333Ï1715582 Indian oW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-28-55 28 050S 050W 4301333118 15506 Indian oW
UTE TRIBAL 8-29-55 29 050S 050W 4301333119 15507 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-29-55 29 050S 050W 4301333120 15504 Indian OW P
TAYLOR FEE 13-22-56 22 050S 060W 4301333121 15525 Fee OW P
WILCOX ELIASON 7-15-56 15 050S 060W 4301333122 15526 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-16-54 16 050S Ñ¾ŠÏ23 15639 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301333128 15420 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301333130 15455 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 16 050 40W 4301333131 15456 Indian OW P
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UTE TRIBAL 4-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332896 15555 IIndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-32D-54 32 050S 040W 4301332897 15312 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-33D-54 33 050S 040W 4301332898 15271 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-32-54 32 050S 040W 4301332925 15503 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-32D-54 32 050S 040W 4301332926 16971 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 16-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332927 15219 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301332928 15421 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332929 15341 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 2 050S 040W 4301332931 15429 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332932 15364 Indian OW P
MYRIN TRIBAL 16-19-55 19 050S 050W 4301332934 15339 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-31-55 31 050S 050W 4301332935 15428 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-31-55 31 050S 050W 4301332936 15354 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 1-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332937 15308 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 5-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301332938 15584 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 7-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301332952 15724 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 5-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301332953 15781 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301332971 15310 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-19-54 19 050S 040W 4301332972 15382 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332973 15245 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-20-54 20 050S 040W 4301332974 15269 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332976 15311 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 10-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332977 15380 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15-55 15 050S 050W [4301332978 15299 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-15-55 15 050S 050W |4301332979 15369 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332980 15342 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-18-55 18 050S 050W 4301332984 15671 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-24-56 24 050S 060W 4301332988 15740 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-24-56 24 OSOS 060W 4301332989 15782 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-56 25 050S _060W 4301332O5627Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 7-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301332991 15617 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301332992 15648 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-25-56 25 050S 060W 4301332993 15561 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333039 15368 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 28 050S 040W 4301333041 15377 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333042 15419 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-22-55 22 050S 050W 4301333044 15381 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301333045 15416 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 23 050S 050W 4301333046 15211 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-55 35 050S 050W 4301333047 15378 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-55 35 050S 050W 4301333048 15367 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301333049 15379 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-12-55 12 050S 050W 301333055 15618 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-13-54 13 050S 040W 301333075 15873 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-54 29 050S 040W 301333076 17074 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 12-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301333077 15575 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333089 15398 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333090 15417 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333091 15397 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301333 15418 India OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-33-54 33 050S 040W 9 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333111 16832 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333112 15440 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333Ïl¾471Indi W P
UTE TRIBAL 11-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333Ìl515470 India OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301333116 15662 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301333Ï1715582 Indian oW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-28-55 28 050S 050W 4301333118 15506 Indian oW
UTE TRIBAL 8-29-55 29 050S 050W 4301333119 15507 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-29-55 29 050S 050W 4301333120 15504 Indian OW P
TAYLOR FEE 13-22-56 22 050S 060W 4301333121 15525 Fee OW P
WILCOX ELIASON 7-15-56 15 050S 060W 4301333122 15526 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-16-54 16 050S Ñ¾ŠÏ23 15639 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301333128 15420 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-16-54 16 050S 040W 4301333130 15455 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 16 050 40W 4301333131 15456 Indian OW P
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UTE TRIBAL 16-17-54 =ffi=7 0508 040W 4301333132 15524 Indian low !p __ + __ 
UTE TRIBAL 10-17-54 ___ 17 .. 0508 040W 14301333133 15581 Indian - E'OW - ---t~-----t---_=___=__= ______ 
UTE TRIBAL 12-24D-55 24 0508 050W 4301333134 15567 ,IndianQYi.. ~ ___ +-__________ _ 
WILCOX FEE 1-20-56 .------'20 0508 060W 14301333150 157451Fee OW P + ______ .----l 
WILCOX FEE 15-16-56 16 _,O'OS _ 060W 4301333151 15527 F~ lOW { -- 1=- __________ _ 
NIEL8EN FEE 13-11-56 11 0508 060W 4301333152 15600 ,Fee OW P 

~;:::;~~~:'~4 - _ :;: ~;~:~ :;~:;;;:;! :;~: :::: ,~~_ L---I--==-
~~i ~~:~t !~~~:~~~ .-- ,;! m~ m: :mm;lnmi :: - Ig: I; -~---t-~ - - = 
UTE TRIBAL 6-29-54 -------1t _ O'OS040W 4301333172 ,15846 lnrum OW P -+-
~~i~~~~~~~~~~5 -_-__ -_--_.-~~2353:- :m:: :mmm ;lL~~= Ig: -j--:_+---_-~-~ 
~i~ i~:~~ :~~!~i5 ________ -_ • Iil= ~;~~ ':~ ':;~:;;;~~ ::::: ~:::: - I~~ -~ -==_1- =---=:.. -= 
~i~ i~:~ !~~!~~~: ---__ I :1

4
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UTE TRIBAL 9-16-54 0508 040W 4301333207 15660 Indian ~_*_ _. ______ . _____ _ 
~~i~~:~!~~!~~;~5-- -------,;; :m E:::mmm ;lE:~; r-r~ -•• -i _ .... -----

UTE TRIBAL 11-36D-55 ------==_ I~~ .--- 10508 050W 4301333214 15702 Indian OW __ P _ _ ___ . ____ --= 
UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-5422 0508 040W 4301333215 15641 'Indian OW P , 

:~:~ i~:~~ ~;~~;:~4 -~_ I;~ - ~~~~ ~:~~ ':~~~~~~~~~ '~~~~; ~::;:-- -rg~~~=i-= i~ -===r---- __ ~n_ - _ _ ~~ 
UTE TRIBAL 9-36D-55 ~ 0508 050W 4301333239 15933 'IIndian OW P -1---____________ _ 

UTE TRIBAL 12-32-55 ___ _-+¥-- 0508 050W 4301333266 !15681 Indian ... j:)W ~--._-fi _____________ -_---
UTE TRIBAL 16-22D-55 -.------i#-- 0508 050W 14301333267 15703 Indian ___ lOW __ ~ ____________ . __ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-55 13 0508 050W 4301333268 15692 Indian OW ----+E----
UTE TRIBAL 7-14-55 ----------- -~ 0508050W!4301333269 15693 Indian - - lOW =1-_ .p:::- -~_--~-- _ --- _--.:~- ._ --_ 
UTE TRIBAL 4-14D-54 tI.t- 0508 040W 4301333270 15679 Indian OW P __ -+ _________ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 98-19-54 - -------~if:9 - 0508 040W 4301333276 16153 iIndian OW P __ ~: ____________ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 __________ 28 __ 0508 040W 4301333277 ~ Indian OW . ,p _ _ _+ _ ___ _ 
~i~i~:~ !~~!~;~4 _--=----:-~=-=-_~--__ ~ ,~~~~ :~~!~~~~~: !i!~~~::!:~j~~ _ ~-i- ---j ___ ---~_-- -~-= 
UTE TRIBAL 10-18-54 ______ 18 0508 1040W,4301333300 i 15747 Indian __ lOW __ ....!f. ____ ----+- _________________ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 5-21-54 21 0508 040W 4301333324 115748 Indian lOW __ =! ___ =j _______ . _____ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 6-3ID-54 ------ -31---1_ 040W 4301333325 16185 :Indian OW P 

*~ ;::~~ :::;::;:;~--=- _. =- -jtc I~:~:~ ':;~:;;;;;~ I :::~: ~': 1~ ---i -~~- -~- --~--
~ITTRIBAL 9-13D-55 __ ----- __ --_-+~2131 0508 050W 4301333328 15892 :Indian _ OW __ P---l ________________ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-55 _ ------_1*_ 0508 ~W '4301333357 :15791 Indian oW- 2--+ ____ -- _____ _ 
~RIBAL 1O-23D-55 _ _______23 _0508 050W 4301333358 15799!Indian__ low _ _ I!, __ . _+-___ _ ___ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 9-26D-55 126 0508 '050W 4301333359 115853 [Indian _OW._ IP _. -- i - _n _ _ 

~~;::: :::;::;:;;_ • .~. ~ [if !~;~~ ~;~~ :;~:;;;;:: I :::;;::: --=-I~~ ~=* U = F -= -..-
UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-55 .... _____ ~ . 0508 j050W 14301333362 115869 Indian _ OW . __ --11>1'.____ ___ .1 ____________ _ 

~ii ~:: ;;:;~:;1--- i-·· ~~~~ ~~~~ :~~!~~~~:! !~~~~ I~::!: . I~~-:i --.-.=t-------------- -
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UTE TRIBAL 4-32-55 _____ - 32- 0508 050W 4301333379 15819 [Indian I_L_ '_ _ ____ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 13H-16-55 _ _ _ _ _ --JI.:L .---+g.508 050W 4301333380 118{~ndian _ ~-----f~ _ -=- 1_ = -=- _ -=_ 
BERRY TRIBAL 7-23-54 W3 10508 1040W 4301333381 15934 Indian _~__.g. t-
~ERRY TRIBAL 9-34:54 ~-~=-=- 34 __ r050~i40W 14301333382 16024 Indian --- Oy.r-~- P_ -=- -~ =-= --=-~---=-~-
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UTE TRIBAL lA-29-54 _ _ __ _ ___ @ ___ ~_~40W 4301333393 17075 +Indi~ __ Tow _ _ __ IP _ _ ... __ _ - _ -- _-

~ TRIBAL 15-34-54 ___ ---1L-~ ;040W 4301333411 iI6037 ~ __ 10",--_~ ___ _ ______ n ____ _ 

BERRY TRI~AL 8-23D-5~ __________ 23 _ 0508 \040W 43013334~zl16lQlIIndian-___ JOW ___ -R-- _ _ __ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 12-29D-55 29 10508 050W 14301333418 i 17307 !Indian -rOW IP -- i - -- - --
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UTE TRIBAL 16-17-54 17 050S 040W 4301333132 15524 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-17-54 17 050S 040W 4301333133 15581 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-24D-55 24 050S 050W 4301333134 15567 Indian OW P
WILCOX FEE 1-20-56 20 050S 060W 4301333150 15745 Fee OW P
WILCOX FEE 15-16-56 16 060W 4301333151 15 OW P
NIELSEN FEE 13-11-56 11 050S 060W 4301333152 15600 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-29-54 3 050S 040W 4301333153 lÌ9Ï¾Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-29-54 040W 4301333154 15831 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301333155 15847 Indian OW P
UE TRIBAL 10-24D-55 24 050S 50W 4301333156 15556 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333157 15505 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 6-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301333172 15846 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 12Q-25-55 25 ÏÏ50S 050W 4301333184 15744 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3G-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301333185 15746 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301333186 15865 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-23D-55 23 050S 050W 14301333187 15996 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333204 15656 Indian OW P
ÜIE TRIBAL 10-14-54 14 040W 4301333205 1568(Ï an OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301333206 15643 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 9-16-54 16 OSOS 040W 4301333207 15660 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301333208 15640 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-13D-55 13 050S 050W 4301333212 15642 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-22D-55 22 050W 4301333213 16831 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL l l-36D-55 36 050S 050W 4301333214 15702 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-54 22 050S 040W 4301333215 15641 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 1-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301333216 15931 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 15-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301333 932 Ind P
UTE TRIBAL 9-36D-55 OSOS 050W 4301333239 15 P
UTE TRIBAL 12-32-55 32 050S 050W 4301333266 15681 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 16-22D-55 22 050S 050W 4301333267 15703 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-55 13 050S 4301333268 15692 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-14-55 14 050S 050W 4301333269 15693 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301333270 15679 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9S-19-54 19 050S 40W 4301333276 16153 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301333277 15818 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-28D-54 28 050S 040W 301333278 15817 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-55 14 050S_ j)50W 301333279 18408 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301333300 15747 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 5-21-54 21 OSOS 040W 4301333324 15748 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333325 16185 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333326 15800 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 16-13D-55 13 050S 050W 4301333327 15891 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-13D-55 13 050S 050W 4301333328 15892 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301333357 15791 OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333358 15799 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333359 15853 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333360 15852 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-55 050S 050W 4301333361 15938 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-55 S 050W 4301333362 15869 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-32D-55 32 OSOS 050W 4 an OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333364 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 7-27D-54 27 SOS 040W 4301333365 15935 Indian OW P
14-ll-56 DLB 11 060W 4301333378 15801 Re P
UTE TRIBAL 4-32-55 32 050S 50W 4301333379 15819 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 13H-16-55 16 050S 50W 4301333380 18357 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 7-23-54 23 81 15934 Indian
BERRY TRIBAL 9-34-54 34 050S 40W 4301333382 16024 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 7-34-54 34 050S 40W 4301333383 16102 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 4-34-54 34 050S 040W 4301333384 16588 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 2-2-65 2 60S 050W 4301333385 16150 eml
FEDERAL 10-3-65 60S 50W 4301333386 16297 ederal W P
FEDERAL 5-4-65 60S 50W 4301333387 17599 deral OW P
UTE TRIBAL lA-29-54 29 050S 40W 4301333393 17075 Indian OW
BERRY TRIBAL 15-34-54 050 16037
BERRY TRIBAL 8-23D-54 23 050S 040W 4301333417 16101 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-29D-55 29 050S 01333418 17 Indian

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

UTE TRIBAL 16-17-54 17 050S 040W 4301333132 15524 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-17-54 17 050S 040W 4301333133 15581 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-24D-55 24 050S 050W 4301333134 15567 Indian OW P
WILCOX FEE 1-20-56 20 050S 060W 4301333150 15745 Fee OW P
WILCOX FEE 15-16-56 16 060W 4301333151 15 OW P
NIELSEN FEE 13-11-56 11 050S 060W 4301333152 15600 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-29-54 3 050S 040W 4301333153 lÌ9Ï¾Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-29-54 040W 4301333154 15831 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301333155 15847 Indian OW P
UE TRIBAL 10-24D-55 24 050S 50W 4301333156 15556 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333157 15505 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 6-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301333172 15846 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 12Q-25-55 25 ÏÏ50S 050W 4301333184 15744 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3G-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301333185 15746 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301333186 15865 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-23D-55 23 050S 050W 14301333187 15996 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333204 15656 Indian OW P
ÜIE TRIBAL 10-14-54 14 040W 4301333205 1568(Ï an OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301333206 15643 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 9-16-54 16 OSOS 040W 4301333207 15660 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301333208 15640 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-13D-55 13 050S 050W 4301333212 15642 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-22D-55 22 050W 4301333213 16831 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL l l-36D-55 36 050S 050W 4301333214 15702 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-54 22 050S 040W 4301333215 15641 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 1-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301333216 15931 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 15-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301333 932 Ind P
UTE TRIBAL 9-36D-55 OSOS 050W 4301333239 15 P
UTE TRIBAL 12-32-55 32 050S 050W 4301333266 15681 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 16-22D-55 22 050S 050W 4301333267 15703 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-55 13 050S 4301333268 15692 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-14-55 14 050S 050W 4301333269 15693 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301333270 15679 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9S-19-54 19 050S 40W 4301333276 16153 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301333277 15818 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-28D-54 28 050S 040W 301333278 15817 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-55 14 050S_ j)50W 301333279 18408 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301333300 15747 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 5-21-54 21 OSOS 040W 4301333324 15748 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333325 16185 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333326 15800 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 16-13D-55 13 050S 050W 4301333327 15891 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-13D-55 13 050S 050W 4301333328 15892 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301333357 15791 OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333358 15799 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333359 15853 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333360 15852 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-55 050S 050W 4301333361 15938 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-55 S 050W 4301333362 15869 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-32D-55 32 OSOS 050W 4 an OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333364 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 7-27D-54 27 SOS 040W 4301333365 15935 Indian OW P
14-ll-56 DLB 11 060W 4301333378 15801 Re P
UTE TRIBAL 4-32-55 32 050S 50W 4301333379 15819 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 13H-16-55 16 050S 50W 4301333380 18357 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 7-23-54 23 81 15934 Indian
BERRY TRIBAL 9-34-54 34 050S 40W 4301333382 16024 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 7-34-54 34 050S 40W 4301333383 16102 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 4-34-54 34 050S 040W 4301333384 16588 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 2-2-65 2 60S 050W 4301333385 16150 eml
FEDERAL 10-3-65 60S 50W 4301333386 16297 ederal W P
FEDERAL 5-4-65 60S 50W 4301333387 17599 deral OW P
UTE TRIBAL lA-29-54 29 050S 40W 4301333393 17075 Indian OW
BERRY TRIBAL 15-34-54 050 16037
BERRY TRIBAL 8-23D-54 23 050S 040W 4301333417 16101 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-29D-55 29 050S 01333418 17 Indian

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

UTE TRIBAL 16-17-54 17 050S 040W 4301333132 15524 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-17-54 17 050S 040W 4301333133 15581 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-24D-55 24 050S 050W 4301333134 15567 Indian OW P
WILCOX FEE 1-20-56 20 050S 060W 4301333150 15745 Fee OW P
WILCOX FEE 15-16-56 16 060W 4301333151 15 OW P
NIELSEN FEE 13-11-56 11 050S 060W 4301333152 15600 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-29-54 3 050S 040W 4301333153 lÌ9Ï¾Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-29-54 040W 4301333154 15831 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301333155 15847 Indian OW P
UE TRIBAL 10-24D-55 24 050S 50W 4301333156 15556 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333157 15505 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 6-29-54 29 050S 040W 4301333172 15846 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 12Q-25-55 25 ÏÏ50S 050W 4301333184 15744 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3G-31-54 31 050S 040W 4301333185 15746 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301333186 15865 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-23D-55 23 050S 050W 14301333187 15996 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333204 15656 Indian OW P
ÜIE TRIBAL 10-14-54 14 040W 4301333205 1568(Ï an OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-54 15 050S 040W 4301333206 15643 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 9-16-54 16 OSOS 040W 4301333207 15660 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-22-54 22 050S 040W 4301333208 15640 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-13D-55 13 050S 050W 4301333212 15642 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-22D-55 22 050W 4301333213 16831 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL l l-36D-55 36 050S 050W 4301333214 15702 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-54 22 050S 040W 4301333215 15641 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 1-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301333216 15931 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 15-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301333 932 Ind P
UTE TRIBAL 9-36D-55 OSOS 050W 4301333239 15 P
UTE TRIBAL 12-32-55 32 050S 050W 4301333266 15681 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 16-22D-55 22 050S 050W 4301333267 15703 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-55 13 050S 4301333268 15692 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-14-55 14 050S 050W 4301333269 15693 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301333270 15679 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9S-19-54 19 050S 40W 4301333276 16153 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 28 050S 040W 4301333277 15818 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-28D-54 28 050S 040W 301333278 15817 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-55 14 050S_ j)50W 301333279 18408 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-18-54 18 050S 040W 4301333300 15747 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 5-21-54 21 OSOS 040W 4301333324 15748 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333325 16185 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333326 15800 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 16-13D-55 13 050S 050W 4301333327 15891 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-13D-55 13 050S 050W 4301333328 15892 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-55 21 050S 050W 4301333357 15791 OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333358 15799 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333359 15853 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333360 15852 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-55 050S 050W 4301333361 15938 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-55 S 050W 4301333362 15869 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-32D-55 32 OSOS 050W 4 an OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301333364 Indian OW P
MOON TRIBAL 7-27D-54 27 SOS 040W 4301333365 15935 Indian OW P
14-ll-56 DLB 11 060W 4301333378 15801 Re P
UTE TRIBAL 4-32-55 32 050S 50W 4301333379 15819 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 13H-16-55 16 050S 50W 4301333380 18357 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 7-23-54 23 81 15934 Indian
BERRY TRIBAL 9-34-54 34 050S 40W 4301333382 16024 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 7-34-54 34 050S 40W 4301333383 16102 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 4-34-54 34 050S 040W 4301333384 16588 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 2-2-65 2 60S 050W 4301333385 16150 eml
FEDERAL 10-3-65 60S 50W 4301333386 16297 ederal W P
FEDERAL 5-4-65 60S 50W 4301333387 17599 deral OW P
UTE TRIBAL lA-29-54 29 050S 40W 4301333393 17075 Indian OW
BERRY TRIBAL 15-34-54 050 16037
BERRY TRIBAL 8-23D-54 23 050S 040W 4301333417 16101 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-29D-55 29 050S 01333418 17 Indian
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FEDERAL 10-2-65 _ 060S 050W 4301333542 16181 Federal .OW _____ p __ -+-- ._. __ . _______ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 4-20D-55 050S 050W 4301333549 18075 Indian "lIOW-__ P -=$-_ _____ _ ___ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 8-23D-55 '23 050S 050W 4301333552 16662 Indian OW =1- _________ _ 
LC TRIBAL 8-28-46 -- ---.... - ---~ 040S '060W 4301333576 ,16155 Indian - OW __ P _ ___ __ _ ___ _ 
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FEDERAL 8 2D 64 -- -- 2 - 060S 1040W 4301333581 16100 FederaL_ OW Ip - I ----=-:-
LC TRIBAL -13~-3-56 -------r 050S '060W 14301333591 i 18129 Indian OW _ P ___ _ _____ _ 
LC FEE 6-12-57 ---- 12 050S 070W 4301333593 17083!F =;=w P 

UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-54 26 i050S 040W 4301333595 1659~~_ .... OW . Ip _ [ .. .-=.---= 
LC TRIBAL 8-4-56 ---'--~14---' 050S 060W 1430133360517046 Indian ___ ~OW __ P _____ _ __ . ___ ._ 

LCTRIBAL 12H-6-56 .---.-...:--#:-- IOSOS O6OW 4301333606 18037 In.;''' _lOW p ___ ; _____ . ___ _ 
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UTE TRIBAL 14-22D-55 n ____ j~n __ 1050S.~OWi*01333717tt6669#di!lIl-- .. low__ _J.!>__n : n__ ___ _ __ _ 
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UTE TRIBAL 8-24-55 24 050S 050W 4301333420 15997 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-25D-55 25 OSOS 050W 4301333421 16589 Indian

__

OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 10-34D-54 34 050S 040W 4301333422 16038 Indian OW P
1-15-56 DLB 15 050S_ 060W 4301333447 15854 Fee OW
FEDERAL 5-3-64 3 060S 040W 4301333448 16098 Federal (OW P
FEDERAL 8-1-64 1 060S 040W 4301333449 16152 Federal OW
FEDERAL 5-4-64 4 060S 040W 4301333450 17851 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 11-10-65 10 060S 050W 4301333451 16281 Federal OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 16-34D-Ñ 34 050S 040W 4301333464 16280 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 9-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301333465 16590 Indian OW _ P
UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333476 16657 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333477 16658 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333478 16659 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301333479 16151 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 5-6-65 6 060S 050W 4301333489 17852 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 16-5-65 5 060S ,050W 43()1333490 16833 Federa OW P
FEDERAL 6-l l-65 11 060S 050W 4301333491 16335 Federal OW P
LC TRIBAL 14-2-56 2 050S 060 1333492 18358 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-31-55 31 OSOS_050W 4301333501 17104 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-55 _ 31 050S_ 050W 301333508 7103 Indiar P
BERRY TRIBAL ll-34D-54 34 050S_ 040W 301333529 16099 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 2-16D-56 16 050S 060W 301333538 17305 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 4-16-56 16 050S 060W 4301333539 16272 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 3-17-56 17 050S 060W 4301333541 16459 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 10-2-65 2 060S 050W 301333542 16181 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-20D-55 20 OSOS 050W 301333549 18075 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333552 16662 Indian OW P
Ï ÌIilBAL 8-28-46 040S 060W 4301333576 16155 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 7-3-56 3 OSOS_060W 4301333577 16379 Indian P
LC TRIBAL 3-5-56 5 050S 060W 301333580 17082 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 8-2D-64 2 060S 040W 4301333581 16100 Federal OW P
LC TRIBAL 13H-3-56 3 050S 060W 4301333591 18129 Indian OW P
LC FEE 6-12-57 12 050S_ 070W 4301333593 17083 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333595 16591 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 8-4-56 4 050S 060W 4301333605 17046 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 12H-6-56 6 050S 060W 4301333606 18037 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 7-7D-56 7 050S 060W 4301333607 18038 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 1-9-56 9 050S 060W 4301333608 16380 Indian W
UTE TRIBAL 5-14-54 14 OSOS_040W 64301333619 16945 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333620 16663 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333621 16664 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-36D-55 36 050S 050W 4301333624 17744 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333625 16619 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-55 50S 050W 4301333626 16777 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-23D-55 23 50S 50W 4301333627 16818 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-27D-55 27 50S 050W 4301333628 16746 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-28D-55 28 05BOW 4301333645 17999 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 13-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333646 18000 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-54 26 m 040W 3673 16299 Indian
UTE FEE 7-13D-55 13 50S 050W 4301333674 18089 Fee )W
UTE TRIBAL 9-20D-55 20 050S 050W 4301333675 17309 Indian OW
LC TRIBA 11-17-56 17 SOS 060W 4301333677 17600)ndian_ OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 26 50S 40W 4301333680 16638 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-26D-54 26 SOS 040W 4301333681 16665 Indian W
UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333682 17031 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301333683 16666 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-27D-55 050S 050W 4301333684 16667 ndian OW
UTE TRIBAL 12-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301333694 16296 ndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301333706 16298 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-29D-55 29 50S 050W 4301333714 168¾ InÃaan OW
UTE TRIBAL 7-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333715 16853 ndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-22D-55 GW 430133371 B ndian
UTE TRIBAL 14-22D-55 22 050S 050W 4301333717 16669 ndian OW P
UTE FEE 2-13-55 __ 3 050S 301333720 1865# nŠan
UTE TRIBAL 7-22D-55 22 050S l050W 4301333721 16670 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-22D-55 2 OSOS 050W 4301333722 6 Indian O P
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UTE TRIBAL 8-24-55 24 050S 050W 4301333420 15997 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-25D-55 25 OSOS 050W 4301333421 16589 Indian

__

OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 10-34D-54 34 050S 040W 4301333422 16038 Indian OW P
1-15-56 DLB 15 050S_ 060W 4301333447 15854 Fee OW
FEDERAL 5-3-64 3 060S 040W 4301333448 16098 Federal (OW P
FEDERAL 8-1-64 1 060S 040W 4301333449 16152 Federal OW
FEDERAL 5-4-64 4 060S 040W 4301333450 17851 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 11-10-65 10 060S 050W 4301333451 16281 Federal OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 16-34D-Ñ 34 050S 040W 4301333464 16280 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 9-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301333465 16590 Indian OW _ P
UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333476 16657 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333477 16658 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333478 16659 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301333479 16151 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 5-6-65 6 060S 050W 4301333489 17852 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 16-5-65 5 060S ,050W 43()1333490 16833 Federa OW P
FEDERAL 6-l l-65 11 060S 050W 4301333491 16335 Federal OW P
LC TRIBAL 14-2-56 2 050S 060 1333492 18358 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-31-55 31 OSOS_050W 4301333501 17104 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-55 _ 31 050S_ 050W 301333508 7103 Indiar P
BERRY TRIBAL ll-34D-54 34 050S_ 040W 301333529 16099 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 2-16D-56 16 050S 060W 301333538 17305 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 4-16-56 16 050S 060W 4301333539 16272 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 3-17-56 17 050S 060W 4301333541 16459 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 10-2-65 2 060S 050W 301333542 16181 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-20D-55 20 OSOS 050W 301333549 18075 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333552 16662 Indian OW P
Ï ÌIilBAL 8-28-46 040S 060W 4301333576 16155 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 7-3-56 3 OSOS_060W 4301333577 16379 Indian P
LC TRIBAL 3-5-56 5 050S 060W 301333580 17082 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 8-2D-64 2 060S 040W 4301333581 16100 Federal OW P
LC TRIBAL 13H-3-56 3 050S 060W 4301333591 18129 Indian OW P
LC FEE 6-12-57 12 050S_ 070W 4301333593 17083 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333595 16591 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 8-4-56 4 050S 060W 4301333605 17046 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 12H-6-56 6 050S 060W 4301333606 18037 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 7-7D-56 7 050S 060W 4301333607 18038 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 1-9-56 9 050S 060W 4301333608 16380 Indian W
UTE TRIBAL 5-14-54 14 OSOS_040W 64301333619 16945 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333620 16663 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333621 16664 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-36D-55 36 050S 050W 4301333624 17744 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333625 16619 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-55 50S 050W 4301333626 16777 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-23D-55 23 50S 50W 4301333627 16818 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-27D-55 27 50S 050W 4301333628 16746 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-28D-55 28 05BOW 4301333645 17999 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 13-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333646 18000 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-54 26 m 040W 3673 16299 Indian
UTE FEE 7-13D-55 13 50S 050W 4301333674 18089 Fee )W
UTE TRIBAL 9-20D-55 20 050S 050W 4301333675 17309 Indian OW
LC TRIBA 11-17-56 17 SOS 060W 4301333677 17600)ndian_ OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 26 50S 40W 4301333680 16638 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-26D-54 26 SOS 040W 4301333681 16665 Indian W
UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333682 17031 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301333683 16666 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-27D-55 050S 050W 4301333684 16667 ndian OW
UTE TRIBAL 12-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301333694 16296 ndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301333706 16298 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-29D-55 29 50S 050W 4301333714 168¾ InÃaan OW
UTE TRIBAL 7-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333715 16853 ndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-22D-55 GW 430133371 B ndian
UTE TRIBAL 14-22D-55 22 050S 050W 4301333717 16669 ndian OW P
UTE FEE 2-13-55 __ 3 050S 301333720 1865# nŠan
UTE TRIBAL 7-22D-55 22 050S l050W 4301333721 16670 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-22D-55 2 OSOS 050W 4301333722 6 Indian O P

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

UTE TRIBAL 8-24-55 24 050S 050W 4301333420 15997 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-25D-55 25 OSOS 050W 4301333421 16589 Indian

__

OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 10-34D-54 34 050S 040W 4301333422 16038 Indian OW P
1-15-56 DLB 15 050S_ 060W 4301333447 15854 Fee OW
FEDERAL 5-3-64 3 060S 040W 4301333448 16098 Federal (OW P
FEDERAL 8-1-64 1 060S 040W 4301333449 16152 Federal OW
FEDERAL 5-4-64 4 060S 040W 4301333450 17851 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 11-10-65 10 060S 050W 4301333451 16281 Federal OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 16-34D-Ñ 34 050S 040W 4301333464 16280 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 9-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301333465 16590 Indian OW _ P
UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333476 16657 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333477 16658 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333478 16659 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301333479 16151 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 5-6-65 6 060S 050W 4301333489 17852 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 16-5-65 5 060S ,050W 43()1333490 16833 Federa OW P
FEDERAL 6-l l-65 11 060S 050W 4301333491 16335 Federal OW P
LC TRIBAL 14-2-56 2 050S 060 1333492 18358 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-31-55 31 OSOS_050W 4301333501 17104 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-55 _ 31 050S_ 050W 301333508 7103 Indiar P
BERRY TRIBAL ll-34D-54 34 050S_ 040W 301333529 16099 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 2-16D-56 16 050S 060W 301333538 17305 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 4-16-56 16 050S 060W 4301333539 16272 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 3-17-56 17 050S 060W 4301333541 16459 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 10-2-65 2 060S 050W 301333542 16181 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-20D-55 20 OSOS 050W 301333549 18075 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333552 16662 Indian OW P
Ï ÌIilBAL 8-28-46 040S 060W 4301333576 16155 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 7-3-56 3 OSOS_060W 4301333577 16379 Indian P
LC TRIBAL 3-5-56 5 050S 060W 301333580 17082 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 8-2D-64 2 060S 040W 4301333581 16100 Federal OW P
LC TRIBAL 13H-3-56 3 050S 060W 4301333591 18129 Indian OW P
LC FEE 6-12-57 12 050S_ 070W 4301333593 17083 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333595 16591 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 8-4-56 4 050S 060W 4301333605 17046 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 12H-6-56 6 050S 060W 4301333606 18037 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 7-7D-56 7 050S 060W 4301333607 18038 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 1-9-56 9 050S 060W 4301333608 16380 Indian W
UTE TRIBAL 5-14-54 14 OSOS_040W 64301333619 16945 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333620 16663 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333621 16664 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-36D-55 36 050S 050W 4301333624 17744 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333625 16619 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-55 50S 050W 4301333626 16777 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-23D-55 23 50S 50W 4301333627 16818 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-27D-55 27 50S 050W 4301333628 16746 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-28D-55 28 05BOW 4301333645 17999 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 13-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333646 18000 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-54 26 m 040W 3673 16299 Indian
UTE FEE 7-13D-55 13 50S 050W 4301333674 18089 Fee )W
UTE TRIBAL 9-20D-55 20 050S 050W 4301333675 17309 Indian OW
LC TRIBA 11-17-56 17 SOS 060W 4301333677 17600)ndian_ OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 26 50S 40W 4301333680 16638 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-26D-54 26 SOS 040W 4301333681 16665 Indian W
UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-54 26 050S 040W 4301333682 17031 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301333683 16666 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-27D-55 050S 050W 4301333684 16667 ndian OW
UTE TRIBAL 12-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301333694 16296 ndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301333706 16298 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 2-29D-55 29 50S 050W 4301333714 168¾ InÃaan OW
UTE TRIBAL 7-29D-55 29 050S 050W 4301333715 16853 ndian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-22D-55 GW 430133371 B ndian
UTE TRIBAL 14-22D-55 22 050S 050W 4301333717 16669 ndian OW P
UTE FEE 2-13-55 __ 3 050S 301333720 1865# nŠan
UTE TRIBAL 7-22D-55 22 050S l050W 4301333721 16670 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-22D-55 2 OSOS 050W 4301333722 6 Indian O P
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UTE TRIBAL 3-29-55 29 050S 050W 4301333723 16857 Indian lOW P
BERRY TRIBAL 10-23D-54 23 050S 040W 4301333724 16592 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL ll-23D-54 23 050S 040W 4301333725 16672 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-24D-55 24 050S 050W 4301333726 16673 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 6-6D-64 6 060S 040W 43 3 084 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-54

26¯
050S 040W 4301333768 17450 Indian OW P

UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301333769 17483 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333782 16856 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55 050S 050W 4301333783 16855 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333784 16852 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301333786 17800 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 9-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333787 16887 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333788 16886 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL ll-32D-54 32 050S 040W 4301333793 17003 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-14D-54 14 OSOS 040W 4301333796 17482 Indian OW T
UTE TRIBAL 4-27D-55 050S 050W 4301333797 16700 Indian OW P
FOY TRIBAL 12H-33-55 33 050S 050W 4301333799 18232 Indian OW P
UE TRIBAL 9-32D-55 32 050S 050W 4301333800 18361 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-54 050S 040W 4301333801 16639 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333859 17859 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 2-34D-54 34 OSOS 040W 4301333867 17889 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333888 N Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-32-54 32 050S_ 040W 4301333902 16819 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333907 17480 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333908 17814 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-20D-55 20 050S 050W 4301333909 18559 Indian OW P
ÜÊ TRIBAL 6-20D-55 20 050S 050W 14301333910 18481 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-55 20 050S 050W 4301333911 18520 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-24D-55 24 OSOS 050W 4301333912 16943 Indian ÒW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333915 17457 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 1-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333916 16889 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 7-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333950 16972 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 9-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333951 16973 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333954 17417 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 14-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333955 17416 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333965 17418 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 1-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301333966 16888 Federal W ¿P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333967 17420 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-36D-55 36 050S 050W 4301333968 17743 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333978 17455 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 2-26D-55 N 050S 050W 4301333979 17456 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 14-23D-54 23 050S 040W 14301333989 17903 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 3-2D-65 2 060S 050W 430133400@ Federal W P
UTE TRIBAL 13-26D-55 26 OSOS 050W 4301334002 17481 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 7-lD-65 1_ 060S 050W 4301334015 17775 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 2-2D-64 2 060S 040W 4301334018 17086 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301334020 17085 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301334028 17785 an OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-26-54 26 050S gW 01g l7413 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 13-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301334043 17100 Indian OW PUM8-5 OS 050 7 18001 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301334058 17842 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 3-15D-54 15 OSOS 040W 4301334059 17477 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 5-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301334060 17479 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 7-11D-65 11 060S 050W 061 17776 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-3D-65 060S 050W 301334065 17124 Federal OW P
MOON TRIBAL 16-27D-54 7 050S 040W 301334109 17414 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-22D-54 22 050S 04 301334116 17415 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-35D-55 050S 050W 301334117 18442 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-55 050S 050W 301334118 17786 Indian P
LC TRIBAL 13-16D-56 16 050S 060W 301334282 17601 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 11-6D-64 060Š 040W 4N3 4 DW P
FEDERAL 14-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301334285 eral OW P
FEDERAL 2-6D-64 S 040W 4301334286 17663 Federal P
FEDERAL 3-5D-64 5 060S 040W |4301334287 17617 Federal OW P

DEM 5¾ 0S 40 4301334288 17649 OW P
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UTE TRIBAL 3-29-55 29 050S 050W 4301333723 16857 Indian lOW P
BERRY TRIBAL 10-23D-54 23 050S 040W 4301333724 16592 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL ll-23D-54 23 050S 040W 4301333725 16672 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-24D-55 24 050S 050W 4301333726 16673 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 6-6D-64 6 060S 040W 43 3 084 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-54

26¯
050S 040W 4301333768 17450 Indian OW P

UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301333769 17483 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333782 16856 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55 050S 050W 4301333783 16855 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333784 16852 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301333786 17800 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 9-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333787 16887 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333788 16886 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL ll-32D-54 32 050S 040W 4301333793 17003 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-14D-54 14 OSOS 040W 4301333796 17482 Indian OW T
UTE TRIBAL 4-27D-55 050S 050W 4301333797 16700 Indian OW P
FOY TRIBAL 12H-33-55 33 050S 050W 4301333799 18232 Indian OW P
UE TRIBAL 9-32D-55 32 050S 050W 4301333800 18361 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-54 050S 040W 4301333801 16639 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333859 17859 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 2-34D-54 34 OSOS 040W 4301333867 17889 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333888 N Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-32-54 32 050S_ 040W 4301333902 16819 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333907 17480 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333908 17814 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-20D-55 20 050S 050W 4301333909 18559 Indian OW P
ÜÊ TRIBAL 6-20D-55 20 050S 050W 14301333910 18481 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-55 20 050S 050W 4301333911 18520 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-24D-55 24 OSOS 050W 4301333912 16943 Indian ÒW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333915 17457 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 1-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333916 16889 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 7-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333950 16972 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 9-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333951 16973 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333954 17417 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 14-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333955 17416 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333965 17418 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 1-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301333966 16888 Federal W ¿P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333967 17420 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-36D-55 36 050S 050W 4301333968 17743 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333978 17455 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 2-26D-55 N 050S 050W 4301333979 17456 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 14-23D-54 23 050S 040W 14301333989 17903 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 3-2D-65 2 060S 050W 430133400@ Federal W P
UTE TRIBAL 13-26D-55 26 OSOS 050W 4301334002 17481 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 7-lD-65 1_ 060S 050W 4301334015 17775 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 2-2D-64 2 060S 040W 4301334018 17086 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301334020 17085 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301334028 17785 an OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-26-54 26 050S gW 01g l7413 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 13-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301334043 17100 Indian OW PUM8-5 OS 050 7 18001 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301334058 17842 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 3-15D-54 15 OSOS 040W 4301334059 17477 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 5-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301334060 17479 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 7-11D-65 11 060S 050W 061 17776 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-3D-65 060S 050W 301334065 17124 Federal OW P
MOON TRIBAL 16-27D-54 7 050S 040W 301334109 17414 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-22D-54 22 050S 04 301334116 17415 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-35D-55 050S 050W 301334117 18442 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-55 050S 050W 301334118 17786 Indian P
LC TRIBAL 13-16D-56 16 050S 060W 301334282 17601 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 11-6D-64 060Š 040W 4N3 4 DW P
FEDERAL 14-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301334285 eral OW P
FEDERAL 2-6D-64 S 040W 4301334286 17663 Federal P
FEDERAL 3-5D-64 5 060S 040W |4301334287 17617 Federal OW P

DEM 5¾ 0S 40 4301334288 17649 OW P

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

UTE TRIBAL 3-29-55 29 050S 050W 4301333723 16857 Indian lOW P
BERRY TRIBAL 10-23D-54 23 050S 040W 4301333724 16592 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL ll-23D-54 23 050S 040W 4301333725 16672 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-24D-55 24 050S 050W 4301333726 16673 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 6-6D-64 6 060S 040W 43 3 084 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-54

26¯
050S 040W 4301333768 17450 Indian OW P

UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301333769 17483 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333782 16856 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55 050S 050W 4301333783 16855 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333784 16852 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301333786 17800 Indian
UTE TRIBAL 9-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333787 16887 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-28D-55 28 050S 050W 4301333788 16886 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL ll-32D-54 32 050S 040W 4301333793 17003 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 9-14D-54 14 OSOS 040W 4301333796 17482 Indian OW T
UTE TRIBAL 4-27D-55 050S 050W 4301333797 16700 Indian OW P
FOY TRIBAL 12H-33-55 33 050S 050W 4301333799 18232 Indian OW P
UE TRIBAL 9-32D-55 32 050S 050W 4301333800 18361 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-54 050S 040W 4301333801 16639 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333859 17859 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 2-34D-54 34 OSOS 040W 4301333867 17889 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333888 N Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-32-54 32 050S_ 040W 4301333902 16819 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-31D-54 31 050S 040W 4301333907 17480 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333908 17814 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-20D-55 20 050S 050W 4301333909 18559 Indian OW P
ÜÊ TRIBAL 6-20D-55 20 050S 050W 14301333910 18481 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-55 20 050S 050W 4301333911 18520 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-24D-55 24 OSOS 050W 4301333912 16943 Indian ÒW P
UTE TRIBAL 14-23D-55 23 050S 050W 4301333915 17457 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 1-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333916 16889 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 7-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333950 16972 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 9-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301333951 16973 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333954 17417 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 14-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333955 17416 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333965 17418 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 1-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301333966 16888 Federal W ¿P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301333967 17420 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 10-36D-55 36 050S 050W 4301333968 17743 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 4-26D-55 26 050S 050W 4301333978 17455 Indian W P
UTE TRIBAL 2-26D-55 N 050S 050W 4301333979 17456 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 14-23D-54 23 050S 040W 14301333989 17903 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 3-2D-65 2 060S 050W 430133400@ Federal W P
UTE TRIBAL 13-26D-55 26 OSOS 050W 4301334002 17481 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 7-lD-65 1_ 060S 050W 4301334015 17775 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 2-2D-64 2 060S 040W 4301334018 17086 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301334020 17085 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-35D-55 35 050S 050W 4301334028 17785 an OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-26-54 26 050S gW 01g l7413 Indian OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 13-23-54 23 050S 040W 4301334043 17100 Indian OW PUM8-5 OS 050 7 18001 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-27D-55 27 050S 050W 4301334058 17842 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 3-15D-54 15 OSOS 040W 4301334059 17477 Indian OW P
ST TRIBAL 5-15D-54 15 050S 040W 4301334060 17479 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 7-11D-65 11 060S 050W 061 17776 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-3D-65 060S 050W 301334065 17124 Federal OW P
MOON TRIBAL 16-27D-54 7 050S 040W 301334109 17414 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-22D-54 22 050S 04 301334116 17415 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 13-35D-55 050S 050W 301334117 18442 Indian P
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-55 050S 050W 301334118 17786 Indian P
LC TRIBAL 13-16D-56 16 050S 060W 301334282 17601 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 11-6D-64 060Š 040W 4N3 4 DW P
FEDERAL 14-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301334285 eral OW P
FEDERAL 2-6D-64 S 040W 4301334286 17663 Federal P
FEDERAL 3-5D-64 5 060S 040W |4301334287 17617 Federal OW P

DEM 5¾ 0S 40 4301334288 17649 OW P
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"'~:.::.~--':'----=-i~=::.:.~=~=--!"-'~=--;0"-'1~::.::~=--;=--~4-=------- --------~---~-~- :;~!;;:~:~ .! ~;:~ ~::;:. ------ r6f---- ~---------+_--------
STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 ilO 050S 040W 4301350245 ~_IIndian _m ______ ~----l'.-----l_-----------I 
UTE TRIBAL 6-14D-55 114 050S '050W 4301350246 17602 Indian OW P _+-: -.--.----------t 
gWFEE 15-10-54 -----+'ll-'-0----"050s--T040W 4301350247 17566 Fee OW ---l.::.P---.---L-".------ ________ . ___ , ______ _ 
(.'.F-'=E~D:=E~RAL~c.::5~-5~D~-.":64~ __________ 1_"'5----+"0."'60"':S--i-' !,0'--"4.".OW-""--+-"'43":.'0~~1."'35":.'0c:::2:-:..59'--+1'--'7.".64.:::8~F""ed",.e::.-ra::....1 OW P-L----- _____ ______ ______ ___ 
j.O.L"':C __ T..,RI=B:-cA..,L ... 6 .... -2 ... 2--:D ___ -::.:56 ___________ t=2=2 ___ c.::.0_=_50=S 060W 4301350260 17567 Indian OW IP I---------------l 

FEDERAL 12-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301350261 17618 Federal. __ . __ ~---2------+------------j 
LC TRIBAL 4-27D-56______ 27 050S 060W 4301350262 17568 Indian IOW_---1!'. ____ -------------1 

FEDERAL 4-5D-64 5 060S 040W 4301350263 17661 Federal OW Ip 
FEDERAL 1-6-64 6 060S 040W 4301350266 17662 Federal lOW IP ---------r--.-.. 

j.O.F-,oE:.:::D:.:::E""RA::..=L.-:4--'-6..--D:....c-6"'-'4'----________ --+=-6 _____ i060S 040W 4301350267 17651 Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 3-6D-64 ___ ~ ____ 1060s 040W 14301350268 17650 Federal_~----fO-P----+-----------------j 

j.O.F--=E..--D..,E~RA~L---5----6 ... D----... 6-"-4-.-_.-. __ -__ -__ ---------- 6 060S 040W 14301350269 17652 Federal +O"--W"----__ -+P"---__ ---+ ___________ _ 
j.O.F--=E..--D..,E~RA~L ___ 8 ___ -6 ... D ___ -... 6_"_4________ ___ _~__ 060S 040W 4301350325 [17664 Federal OW P 
j.O.F--=E..--D..,E~RA~L ___ l ... 0'__'-I__:D ___ -.... 65 __________ ., __ I 060S 050W!4301350326 18027 Federal OW P 

FEDERAL ll-lD-65 I 060S 050W 4301350327 :18039 Federal ~ ___ t-----+-------------t 

j.O.F-,oE:.:::D:.:::ERA=--:L"'::'..'"12 ..... -.... lD ___ -""65_________ [I 060S 050W 4301350328 18040 Federal -+O~W __ +P-.---+----------1 
j.O.F:.:::E:.:::D ... E~RA.....-:L'--'I'"::3-'-I..,D:..-6 ... 5 _______________ 11 060S 050W 4301350329 18042 Federal OW __ 1'.. ___ __ _ 
FEDERAL 14-lD-65 ___ . _______ ----I-c::l___ 060S ,050W 4301350330 118041 !Federal OW __ ~--__ ,_-.--,,--+------------~ 
FEDERAL 13-5D-64 ___________ ~-5----- _. +-"0-"'60 ... S'--+0"'-'4 ... 0 .... W'_+"4""30 .... 1 .... 3""50 .... 3 ... 3.:..7, +1::.:7...:.7 ___ 14~F ... ed .... e~ra:::.I __ -+===O--'-W'--__ --t= ______ ._. . ____ . __ . _______ --1 
FEDERAL 14-5D-64 i5 060S040W 4301350338 17715 I Federal OW P ----------+'I ----- --+-"-"'~+"'_' ...... '_+"""""-"=="--+-::.:...:.------;.-..--==-----+'"'--""-------t=----+------- ---- --.--------
FEDERAL 9-lD-6=-:5'--________ _ ,1- 060S 050W 4301350342 18026 IFederal _____ IOW __ ..J!-=-P ___ +-__________ _ 

j.O.F-=E=D-=E~RA=_=L=_.:I:.::3_'-6::.::D=__-_=_64_=____________ 6 060S 040W 4301350347 17619 Federal lOW 'P _________ . ______ --1 

FEDERAL 11-5D-64 ________ ~- 060S 040W 4301350348 17690 Federal ___ -tiO-=--:..W __ -i--,P ___ -+ _____________ _ 
j.O.F--=E--::Dc-:E--.:RA~L .... I:.::2c.:-5::.::D=__-_=_64_=___ ___________ ---+=-5 __ --+=-06::.:0::.::S'--+-'0 ... 4_=_OW"-'---+4 ... 3=-:0c.=.1::.:35=-:0-=-34 ... 9:...+1:..:.7.:...71:.:3--+=-Fe=-:d=e=-=ra=-I ___ +1 O=-W"-'-- _ __ L-----+------------
FEDERAL 8-lD-65 ___ -+=I __ --+=-06 ... :0=S 050W 4301350350 18025 :Federal. ___ f!:'#- iP __ _____ ______ --1 

I-"U::..:T'_"'E ___ T .... RI=B:-cA:=L:..:3:....-::..14:.::D ___ --:..54_=___ __________ --11-=-14-'---_ 050S 040W 4301350389 17904 I Indian __ . _+' O=-W"-'--_-------j,-=-P ___ --+-_______________ --I 
UTE TRIBAL 1-34D-55 ------+1 3,-,4,----" _+-=,0 ... 50=-=S,--+0 .... 5-=-OW-'-'--i",,43::.:0:..:1.:c35::.:O=--:4-=-08-=-+1=--,7-=-9-:.:31=---;.::iI,n=d=ian=-__ -+O-=--"'W'----___ l!'_ ____ 1---___________ _ 

UTE TRIBAL 7-14-54 114 050S 040W 4301350409 17924 Indian_ S, .... W------t=lp-----+--. __ ,, ______ ----t 
UTE TRIBAL 8-2lD-55 :21 050S 050W 4301350435 17963 1 Indian _---+-"O...:.W _____ t=IP __ . ___ _ 

I-"U---T'-"'E--T .... RI=B:-cA==L"--'8---3::.:4'-"'D----.:'"55----__ -. -__ ~_=__=_ __ -_··_--=---:-___ -_:'-:..3---4"_-_-_-_--i+ .... 0"".::.:5"-"0~S~~0-;5-=-0"--'W~: ... 4..,.3-;,0:1.:'"3 ___ 5;,0'-'4;3 ... 6~~:1~7.-..9 ... 5--;2~~I ... n:d=i ..... an:-'---· -----rl o0'---WW---------l-i P::--------t-----.. ---_____ ----1 

~U---T'-"'E"--T .... RI=B ... A==L ___ 5----.... 16~D-----=-54-"------,,··-------+=-1164"------ __ .-+"0-"50:":S"---+'0 ... 4_=_OW".'....f,.::43=-=0 .... 1 ... 35=-=0 ... 4 ... 75'--+1'.:.7.-..99::..:I~In ... d ... ian=-__ ! OW ___ ---l-:,: Pp----- 1----- --.---.-------1 
UTE TRIBAL 12-14D-55 050S 050W 4301350476 17973 Indian ' 

15 ·-+---OW --------':,-=-P-----+------------
UTE TRIBAL 8-15D-55 __________ ,_. -t= ___ c.::.0::.:50=S 050W 4301350477 17974 Indian ___ -+-=:....:.:.. __ +, '---______ " 
UTE TRIBAL 3-14-55 _____________ --+1--'-4_--1-=-05::..:0:.=.S 050W 4301350478 18002 Indian iOWP --.------1------------ ___ _ 

UTE TRIBAL 5-14-55 14 050S 050W 4301350479 18021 Indian OW 'P 
- -" - .,.-=-..'-'---------;-=----- --- ._-_. -------._._-

UTE TRIBAL 8-IOD-54 _ _____ 10 050S 040W 4301350488 18099 I Indian OW ____ ~:P----+-----__ , _________ -1 
UTE TRIBAL 7-34-55 ,34 050S 050W 4301350510 17949 Indian iowp 

",F---=E-.--D::.::E ___ RA~L __ 4,--4 ... D ___ -... 6_=_5_-_--__ ,,-_.-__ -_-_~=-, _ _=__=_~1:4~---·.-· +0 ... 6 ... 0:.:::S--I-"'0""50"":'W'"-+4..,.3-"'0.":"13 ... 5-"'0 ... 52 ___ 1+1 .... 85 ... 5-"'7+F"--'e .... d~er ... al __ --_· __ ~_~'--'-O:-._ ... W====~:~P===-_-_-__ --_·--+I--_.·=========-,,--.-=---~= 
FEDERAL 6-3D-64 _____ __~-- 060S 040W 4301350522 '18073 Federal tow ~_ 

FEDERAL l-lD-64 II 060S 040W 4301350524 Fl ... 80 ... 8 .... 8+F ... e ... d ... er""'al'----_-iI..__O'_'W=---.___ g __________ _ 
FEDERAL 7-2D-65---------·----+-2=-- 060S 050W 4301350525 18100 ,Federal OW iP------+-----__ ~_" _____ . __ 

BERRY TRIBAL 12-34D-54u~==---=-~-==d!. - 050S 040W 4301350527 179981Indian -. OW lP _ . ______ .. __ _ 
FEDERAL 15~5D-65 ___ __ .----2-- 060S 1050W 4301350553 18537 'Federal low __ 11'. ___ --+ _____ ,,,. __________ _ 
FEDERAL 11-4D-64 :4 060S ,040W 4301350565 18043 ,Federal OW P . 
FEDERAL 6-6D-65 ---- ____6 060S050W 4301350566 118521 Federal OW- cf-- ----r ~- _________ .:.. -::::-
LC TRIBAL 3-15D-56 ______ .. ·15 050S 1060W 4301350598 i 18097!Indian OW P ___ +'1 _____________ --1 
LC TRIBAL 8-16D-56 i 16 050S ;060W 4301350599 ! 18161 Indian OW P- I 

LC FEE 16-16D-56 ---- -- '16 050S060W 4301350601 : 18165 Fee OW -r I 

LC TRIBAL 1O-16D-_56___==__----=:= '16 050S i060W 4301350602 '18586Indian--~ ______ --J=- ~-_._--,,_. =--~--_-_-_-'_"-____=_ 
LC TRIBAL 15-22D-56 ____ 122 050S i060W 4301350606 )8278 iIndian OW cf---- _+-_____ _ 
LC TRIBAL 5-23D-56 _ ________ & __ u 050S 060W i430135Q§~1..~'Indian OW P ____ ---+-- ______ _ 
LC TRIBAL 5-14D-56 14 050S 060W 4301350661 ,18219 Indian OW P , 
~FEE 14-IOD-54 .. ---- ------- rw--!o50S 040W4301350686 118070 Fee ____ S'!! P- .---r------ .-------
LC FEE 1-22D-56 ----- -----"22- 1050S 060W 4301350718+18101 Fee - OW -----:p-----I----- .-------
FEDERAL 8-2D-65--------------"2'----tQ6os 050W 4301350719 18614 F~deral-- 'OW Ip ---1---- -.---

FEDERAL 1-2D-64 __ ==-~-u--==~-t- __ k~os 040W 430l35073O 18585 Federal .. _ ~OW _~- - --~I--=--=-____ ----------:: 
~RAL 7-2D-6~ ___________ ~ _____ ~ 040W 4301350734 18584 Federal .~--.L!' ______ .u________ . ___ _ 

~;= !~-=~~ .. -:.=_--t_---~~-S :;~~;;~~;~ ~t~:::~:~- ~-,~: ~-. r---=-~=~~~-=-~~-
~ERAL 12-3D-64________ 13 _____ ~60S040\\' 4301350737 1 1862Q IFederal .. _~ ---If-.-- -"----t---------- . ______ _ 
LC TRIBA!- 3-2lD-56___ ____ __ 21 ___ ~OS_~ ~30135Q75~ ~846~ [Indian_ _'S2Vi ... __ . ...f.... __ I_______ _ __ 
LC TRIBAL 5-21D-56 121 t050S !060W 4301350752 i 18286 Indian OW :P ~ 

~~~~~~ ~~~~~:; u~= ·==H---+6~l~~+Woi~~~~~~ !:g~ ~:::~:! --~=~-T~~----+----~--~~_=~~ 

------- ,----
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SFW TRIBAL 10-10D-54 10 050S 040W 4301334295 17564 Indian OW P
SF3¥ TTUO3ACL9-1013-54 10 050S 0409V 4301334296 17565 Inditui OVV P
STitTE T1003AdL16-10-54 10 050S 0409V 4301350245 17553 Indieui ONV P
LTTETIt03/dL6-14I3-55 14 050S 0509V 4301350246 17602 Indieni ONV P
SFW FEE 15-10-54 10 050S 040W 4301350247 17566 Fee OW P
FEITEFutL5-5D-64 5 060S 0409V 4301350259 17648 Fedend O3W P
LC T1003/dL6-22L)-56 22 050S 0609V 4301350260 17567 Indian ONV P
FEDIEFLAL12-6EL-64 6 060S 0409V 4301350261 17618 Federal ONV P
LC TRIBAL 4-27D-56 27 050S 060W 4301350262 17568 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 4-5D-64 5 060S 040W 4301350263 17661 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 1-6-64 6 060S 040W 4301350266 17662 Federal OW P
FEDEFLAL4-6D-64 6 060S 0409V 4301350267 17651 Federal O3W P
FEDERAL 3-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301350268 17650 Federal OW P
FEDEFutL5-6D-64 6 060S 0409V 4301350269 17652 Fedend OA¥ P
FEDERAL8-6D-64 6 060S 040MI 4301350325 17664 Federal ONV P
FEJ)EFLAL 10-lD-65 1 060S 050TV 4301350326 18027 Fedend OA¥ P
FElDERALLll-lEL-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350327 18039 Federal ()NV P
FEJ)EFbtL 12-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350328 18040 Fedend OA¥ P
FER)EFLAL13-1D-65 1 060S 050TV 4301350329 18042 Fedend CA¥ P
FEJ)EFLAL 14-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350330 18041 Federed CAW P
FEDEFLAL 13-5EL-64 5 060S 0409V 4301350337 17714 UFederal ONV P
FEDERAL 14-5D-64 5 060S 040W 4301350338 17715 Federal OW P
FEDEILAL9-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350342 18026 Federal CAW P
FEDERAL 13-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301350347 17619 Federal OW P
FEDEFLAL ll-5D-64 5 060S 0409V 4301350348 17690 Fedend ONV DP
FEDERAL 12-5D-64 5 060S 040W 4301350349 17713 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 8-lD-65 1 060S 050W 4301350350 18025 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301350389 17904 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-34D-55 34 050S 050W 4301350408 17931 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301350409 17924 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301350435 17963 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-34D-55 34 050S 050W 4301350436 17952 Indian _ OW
UTE TRIBAL 5-16D-54 16 050S 040W 4301350475 17991 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-14D-55 14 050S 050W 4301350476 17973 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-15D-55 15 050S 050W 4301350477 17974 Indian OW P
LTTE11t[BAUL3-14-55 14 050S 050NV 4301350478 18002 Indima 39V P
UTE TRIBAL 5-14-55 14 050S 050W 4301350479 18021 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-10D-54 10 050S 040W 4301350488 18099 Indian OW P
LTTEITU[B/db7-34-55 34 050S 0509V 4301350510 17949 Indiani 1]NV P
FEDERAL 4-4D-65 4 060S 050W 4301350521 18557 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 6-3D-64 3 060S 040W 4301350522 18073 Federal [OW P
FEDEILAL 1-lD-64 1 060S 0409V 4301350524 18088 Federal Oli P
FEDERAL 7-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301350525 18100 Federal OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 12-34D-54 34 050S 040W 4301350527 17998 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 15-5D-65 5 060S 050W 4301350553 18537 Federal OW P
FEDERAL ll-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301350565 18043 Federal OW P
FEDERAL6-6D-65 _ 6 060S 050W 4301350566 18521 Federal OW P
LASITUBAUL3-1513-56 15 050S 0609V 4301350598 18097 Indiani ONV P
LC TRIBAL 8-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301350599 18161 Indian OW P
LCFEE 16-16D-56 16 050S 0609V 4301350601 18165 Fee ONV P
LC TRIBAL 10-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301350602 18586 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 15-22D-56 22 050S 060W 4301350606 18278 Indian OW P
LA: ITUlBAUL5-2313-56 23 050S 0609V 4301350625 18285 Indian ONV P
LC TTUBALS-14D-56 14 050S 0609V 4301350661 18219 Indiam C3¥ P
SFM'FEE 14-10D-54 10 050S 0409V 4301350686 18070 Fee 03¥ P
LC FEE 1-22D-56 22 OSOS 0609/ 4301350718 18101 Fee ONV P
FEDERAL 8-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301350719 18614 Federal OW P
FEITEILAL 1-2D-64 2 060S 040NV 4301350730 18585 Federal Cn¥ P
FEDERAL 7-2D-64 2 060S 040W 4301350734 18584 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 10-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301350735 18162 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 4-3D-64 3 060S 040W 4301350736 18621 Federal P
FEDEILAL12-3D-64 3 060S 0409V 4301350737 18620 Federed ONV P
LC TRIBAL 3-21D-56 21 050S 060W 4301350751 18462 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 5-21D-56 21 050S 060W 4301350752 18286 Indian P
FEDEILAL2-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350759 18172 Federal ONV P
FEDEILAL3-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350760 18173 Federal ()NV P

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
EfectiveJune 1,2014

SFW TRIBAL 10-10D-54 10 050S 040W 4301334295 17564 Indian OW P
SF3¥ TTUO3ACL9-1013-54 10 050S 0409V 4301334296 17565 Inditui OVV P
STitTE T1003AdL16-10-54 10 050S 0409V 4301350245 17553 Indieui ONV P
LTTETIt03/dL6-14I3-55 14 050S 0509V 4301350246 17602 Indieni ONV P
SFW FEE 15-10-54 10 050S 040W 4301350247 17566 Fee OW P
FEITEFutL5-5D-64 5 060S 0409V 4301350259 17648 Fedend O3W P
LC T1003/dL6-22L)-56 22 050S 0609V 4301350260 17567 Indian ONV P
FEDIEFLAL12-6EL-64 6 060S 0409V 4301350261 17618 Federal ONV P
LC TRIBAL 4-27D-56 27 050S 060W 4301350262 17568 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 4-5D-64 5 060S 040W 4301350263 17661 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 1-6-64 6 060S 040W 4301350266 17662 Federal OW P
FEDEFLAL4-6D-64 6 060S 0409V 4301350267 17651 Federal O3W P
FEDERAL 3-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301350268 17650 Federal OW P
FEDEFutL5-6D-64 6 060S 0409V 4301350269 17652 Fedend OA¥ P
FEDERAL8-6D-64 6 060S 040MI 4301350325 17664 Federal ONV P
FEJ)EFLAL 10-lD-65 1 060S 050TV 4301350326 18027 Fedend OA¥ P
FElDERALLll-lEL-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350327 18039 Federal ()NV P
FEJ)EFbtL 12-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350328 18040 Fedend OA¥ P
FER)EFLAL13-1D-65 1 060S 050TV 4301350329 18042 Fedend CA¥ P
FEJ)EFLAL 14-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350330 18041 Federed CAW P
FEDEFLAL 13-5EL-64 5 060S 0409V 4301350337 17714 UFederal ONV P
FEDERAL 14-5D-64 5 060S 040W 4301350338 17715 Federal OW P
FEDEILAL9-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350342 18026 Federal CAW P
FEDERAL 13-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301350347 17619 Federal OW P
FEDEFLAL ll-5D-64 5 060S 0409V 4301350348 17690 Fedend ONV DP
FEDERAL 12-5D-64 5 060S 040W 4301350349 17713 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 8-lD-65 1 060S 050W 4301350350 18025 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301350389 17904 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-34D-55 34 050S 050W 4301350408 17931 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301350409 17924 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301350435 17963 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-34D-55 34 050S 050W 4301350436 17952 Indian _ OW
UTE TRIBAL 5-16D-54 16 050S 040W 4301350475 17991 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-14D-55 14 050S 050W 4301350476 17973 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-15D-55 15 050S 050W 4301350477 17974 Indian OW P
LTTE11t[BAUL3-14-55 14 050S 050NV 4301350478 18002 Indima 39V P
UTE TRIBAL 5-14-55 14 050S 050W 4301350479 18021 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-10D-54 10 050S 040W 4301350488 18099 Indian OW P
LTTEITU[B/db7-34-55 34 050S 0509V 4301350510 17949 Indiani 1]NV P
FEDERAL 4-4D-65 4 060S 050W 4301350521 18557 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 6-3D-64 3 060S 040W 4301350522 18073 Federal [OW P
FEDEILAL 1-lD-64 1 060S 0409V 4301350524 18088 Federal Oli P
FEDERAL 7-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301350525 18100 Federal OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 12-34D-54 34 050S 040W 4301350527 17998 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 15-5D-65 5 060S 050W 4301350553 18537 Federal OW P
FEDERAL ll-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301350565 18043 Federal OW P
FEDERAL6-6D-65 _ 6 060S 050W 4301350566 18521 Federal OW P
LASITUBAUL3-1513-56 15 050S 0609V 4301350598 18097 Indiani ONV P
LC TRIBAL 8-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301350599 18161 Indian OW P
LCFEE 16-16D-56 16 050S 0609V 4301350601 18165 Fee ONV P
LC TRIBAL 10-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301350602 18586 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 15-22D-56 22 050S 060W 4301350606 18278 Indian OW P
LA: ITUlBAUL5-2313-56 23 050S 0609V 4301350625 18285 Indian ONV P
LC TTUBALS-14D-56 14 050S 0609V 4301350661 18219 Indiam C3¥ P
SFM'FEE 14-10D-54 10 050S 0409V 4301350686 18070 Fee 03¥ P
LC FEE 1-22D-56 22 OSOS 0609/ 4301350718 18101 Fee ONV P
FEDERAL 8-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301350719 18614 Federal OW P
FEITEILAL 1-2D-64 2 060S 040NV 4301350730 18585 Federal Cn¥ P
FEDERAL 7-2D-64 2 060S 040W 4301350734 18584 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 10-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301350735 18162 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 4-3D-64 3 060S 040W 4301350736 18621 Federal P
FEDEILAL12-3D-64 3 060S 0409V 4301350737 18620 Federed ONV P
LC TRIBAL 3-21D-56 21 050S 060W 4301350751 18462 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 5-21D-56 21 050S 060W 4301350752 18286 Indian P
FEDEILAL2-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350759 18172 Federal ONV P
FEDEILAL3-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350760 18173 Federal ()NV P

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
EfectiveJune 1,2014

SFW TRIBAL 10-10D-54 10 050S 040W 4301334295 17564 Indian OW P
SF3¥ TTUO3ACL9-1013-54 10 050S 0409V 4301334296 17565 Inditui OVV P
STitTE T1003AdL16-10-54 10 050S 0409V 4301350245 17553 Indieui ONV P
LTTETIt03/dL6-14I3-55 14 050S 0509V 4301350246 17602 Indieni ONV P
SFW FEE 15-10-54 10 050S 040W 4301350247 17566 Fee OW P
FEITEFutL5-5D-64 5 060S 0409V 4301350259 17648 Fedend O3W P
LC T1003/dL6-22L)-56 22 050S 0609V 4301350260 17567 Indian ONV P
FEDIEFLAL12-6EL-64 6 060S 0409V 4301350261 17618 Federal ONV P
LC TRIBAL 4-27D-56 27 050S 060W 4301350262 17568 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 4-5D-64 5 060S 040W 4301350263 17661 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 1-6-64 6 060S 040W 4301350266 17662 Federal OW P
FEDEFLAL4-6D-64 6 060S 0409V 4301350267 17651 Federal O3W P
FEDERAL 3-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301350268 17650 Federal OW P
FEDEFutL5-6D-64 6 060S 0409V 4301350269 17652 Fedend OA¥ P
FEDERAL8-6D-64 6 060S 040MI 4301350325 17664 Federal ONV P
FEJ)EFLAL 10-lD-65 1 060S 050TV 4301350326 18027 Fedend OA¥ P
FElDERALLll-lEL-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350327 18039 Federal ()NV P
FEJ)EFbtL 12-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350328 18040 Fedend OA¥ P
FER)EFLAL13-1D-65 1 060S 050TV 4301350329 18042 Fedend CA¥ P
FEJ)EFLAL 14-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350330 18041 Federed CAW P
FEDEFLAL 13-5EL-64 5 060S 0409V 4301350337 17714 UFederal ONV P
FEDERAL 14-5D-64 5 060S 040W 4301350338 17715 Federal OW P
FEDEILAL9-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350342 18026 Federal CAW P
FEDERAL 13-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301350347 17619 Federal OW P
FEDEFLAL ll-5D-64 5 060S 0409V 4301350348 17690 Fedend ONV DP
FEDERAL 12-5D-64 5 060S 040W 4301350349 17713 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 8-lD-65 1 060S 050W 4301350350 18025 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-14D-54 14 050S 040W 4301350389 17904 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-34D-55 34 050S 050W 4301350408 17931 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 7-14-54 14 050S 040W 4301350409 17924 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-21D-55 21 050S 050W 4301350435 17963 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-34D-55 34 050S 050W 4301350436 17952 Indian _ OW
UTE TRIBAL 5-16D-54 16 050S 040W 4301350475 17991 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 12-14D-55 14 050S 050W 4301350476 17973 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-15D-55 15 050S 050W 4301350477 17974 Indian OW P
LTTE11t[BAUL3-14-55 14 050S 050NV 4301350478 18002 Indima 39V P
UTE TRIBAL 5-14-55 14 050S 050W 4301350479 18021 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-10D-54 10 050S 040W 4301350488 18099 Indian OW P
LTTEITU[B/db7-34-55 34 050S 0509V 4301350510 17949 Indiani 1]NV P
FEDERAL 4-4D-65 4 060S 050W 4301350521 18557 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 6-3D-64 3 060S 040W 4301350522 18073 Federal [OW P
FEDEILAL 1-lD-64 1 060S 0409V 4301350524 18088 Federal Oli P
FEDERAL 7-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301350525 18100 Federal OW P
BERRY TRIBAL 12-34D-54 34 050S 040W 4301350527 17998 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 15-5D-65 5 060S 050W 4301350553 18537 Federal OW P
FEDERAL ll-4D-64 4 060S 040W 4301350565 18043 Federal OW P
FEDERAL6-6D-65 _ 6 060S 050W 4301350566 18521 Federal OW P
LASITUBAUL3-1513-56 15 050S 0609V 4301350598 18097 Indiani ONV P
LC TRIBAL 8-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301350599 18161 Indian OW P
LCFEE 16-16D-56 16 050S 0609V 4301350601 18165 Fee ONV P
LC TRIBAL 10-16D-56 16 050S 060W 4301350602 18586 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 15-22D-56 22 050S 060W 4301350606 18278 Indian OW P
LA: ITUlBAUL5-2313-56 23 050S 0609V 4301350625 18285 Indian ONV P
LC TTUBALS-14D-56 14 050S 0609V 4301350661 18219 Indiam C3¥ P
SFM'FEE 14-10D-54 10 050S 0409V 4301350686 18070 Fee 03¥ P
LC FEE 1-22D-56 22 OSOS 0609/ 4301350718 18101 Fee ONV P
FEDERAL 8-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301350719 18614 Federal OW P
FEITEILAL 1-2D-64 2 060S 040NV 4301350730 18585 Federal Cn¥ P
FEDERAL 7-2D-64 2 060S 040W 4301350734 18584 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 10-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301350735 18162 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 4-3D-64 3 060S 040W 4301350736 18621 Federal P
FEDEILAL12-3D-64 3 060S 0409V 4301350737 18620 Federed ONV P
LC TRIBAL 3-21D-56 21 050S 060W 4301350751 18462 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 5-21D-56 21 050S 060W 4301350752 18286 Indian P
FEDEILAL2-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350759 18172 Federal ONV P
FEDEILAL3-lD-65 1 060S 0509V 4301350760 18173 Federal ()NV P



Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115) 
Effective June 1, 2014 

FEOERAL 5-10-65. ___ ._. 1 060S 050W 4301350761 18174 Federal OW ---t=-P~~-~f--~~~~~~~__1 
FEOERAL 9-20-65 2 060S 050W 4301350762 18245 Federal OW p __ ~~.~ 
~ERAL1!-20-65 .. _ _ __ _nu 1. ___ .. ~1050W 14301350763 18589 Federal OW P : ________ . __ ._ 
FEOERAL 15-20-65 2 060S !050W'4301350764 18590 Federal OW P I _______ ~ __ ._ 
LC TRIBAL 14-140-56 14 050S 060W 4301350776 18287 Indian OW_~t-~ __ +_._._ __ 
LC FEE 2-200-56 20 050S i060W 4301350777 18622 Fee OW P --------l---~~-----
LC TRIBAL 12-220-56 _______ . _____ B. 050S 060W 4301350780 18341 'Indian ~-.---+P~-~~--+'~~~--~~~---I 

~F~E~0~E~RA~L~3~-4~0~-~6~5~~~~~~~~~4~~~0~60~S~0~5~0=W~4~30~1~3~50~7~82~1~8~5~56~F~ed~e~ra~I~--~O=W~~_tP~~~_+~~~~~ __ ~ ___ _ 
FEOERAL 6-40-65 '4 060S 050W 4301350783 19162 Federal 'OW P 

----~~-----t--

FEOERAL 12-40-65 ._.____ 14 060S 050W 4301350784 19171 Federal OW iP -- t--.~-~---~.~~~.----l 
LC TRIBAL 14-150-56____ 15 050S 060W 4301350834 18362 Indian OWP._ 
UTE TRIBAL 71-210-54 .___ _ .. __ ._ ell.---~ 040W'4301350852 ,18423 Indian OW ___ .t. ______ --1-'=B~E::.RR::_.:._Y"-'P'____'I".":"Lc.--O _____ T ____ E ____ O_...R_'_'2 ___ 4 ... 6'___"-0 ..... 
UTE TRIBAL 8L-21O-54 ___+~!.___ ~ ~ 430135085318423 Indian OW P ,BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0 
UTE TRIBAL IOS-210-54 21 050S 1040W 4301350854 18423 Indian OW P BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0 
UTE TRIBAL 11-11~4 __ . __ ~___ 11 050S i040W 4301350861 18775 I Indian OW P ______ . ___ ~ __ ~~_ 
LC TRIBAL 2-280-56 28 050S 1060W 4301350866 18592 'Indian OW P 
LC FEE 8-280-56 28 050S 060W 4301350867 18342 Fee . _______ lOW ____ ~~--.~+----.---~----~~--1 
LC TRIBAL 6-270-5§__ 127 050S 060W 4301350868 18480 Indian _ lOW _____ .f.. _____ --------------__1 
LC FEE 15-230-56_ ~~_ 050S 060W 4301350870 18410 #~ ____ ._~_+;O------W~----I-'-P---_+--------__l 
LC TRIBAL 15-26-56 :26 050S 060W 4301350871 18377 Indian ----ll..--O-----W---------l-"P----+------------l 
UTE TRIBAL 16-11-55 ·-·-Til 1050S 050W 4301350888 18707 Indian OW ,P __ ._ .. __ _ 

--t----~~~~~~~~~~~F===~----+~~~~~---~------.- --
LC TRIBAL 2-50-56 ___ 5 1050S 060W 4301350925 18568 Indian ___ I--"0:.."W ____ ~_+'_Ip~~~_+_~~~~~~~_____j 
LC TRIBAL 2-90-56 9 050S 060W 4301350926 18425 Indian OW P 
LC FEE 8-29-45 29 040S 050W 14301350928 ,18313 Fee OW P I 
LC FEE 13-29-45 -- ... _.. 29 040S 050W 14301350929 '18426 Fee --------+-=O-=W':-------+=p::------+-------------f 

LC FEE 9-120-57-- 12 050S 070W 430135096318541 Fee- D-W----r-p-- i 

----.j.. __ . _._ ..... -_ .. _---_._-

LC FEE 1 .. 22-57 --_._-- 22 050S 070W 14301350965 : 18558 Fee OW P ----r---------------
LC TRIBAL 11-30~56-=_---~----l: 050S 060W 4301350966 ~ 18464 Indian. ____ . +{) ___ W-'"-----·--_·--=--~-~+:P-=--~-=--=--=--=-~+:.-=--=--=--=--=--=--=--.-----.---.-.-----·_-_---I 
LC TRIBAL 3-34-45 34 040S !050W 4301350976 18661 Indian OW P 
LC TRIBAL 9-100-56 -- .----.---- 10 _~__ 050S To6OW 4301350987 18944 Indian OW --rp------- -.-- --------
~-TRIBAL 10-90-56 9 050S 1060W 4301350990 18864 ilndi~ OW P --.----~~~__1 
LC FEE 10-310-45 31 040S 050W 4301350994 18443 'Fee _.~ p_. _____ _ 
VIEIRA TRIBAL 4-4-54 4 050S :040W 4301350997 18747 [Indian OW --_tp~---+----.--~-

... ----.. +-~~~--~~~___l 

LC TRIBAL 10-21-56 . __ 21 050S 1060W 4301350999 18439 :Indian ---+0::-c:W=--=----+P=--------t-~._._. ________ ___l 

FEOERAL 1-50-64 5 060S 1040W 4301351012 18720 Federal OW P --.- -~~---- _._-_._._--------1 
FEOERAL 2-50-64_ ._~~~_ . _ 5 060S 040W 4301351013 18723 Federal ___ .. _-r:0c:::W=--=--_--+P=---__ -+. ________________ --1 

FEOERAL 7-50-64 __ ______ ~n 060S 040W 4301351014 18722 iFederal IOW_ --t.-----+-----.-
FEOERAL 8-50-64 ___ ~~_. ,5 060S 040W 4301351015 18721 Federal ._ .. __ +--"O'--'W-'---_----t-=-IP ____ -.--------------1 
MYRIN TRIBAL 15-10-55 ! 10 050S 050W 4301351024 18771 Indian low +f . ____ ~ 
~TRIBAL 15-150-56 ---~- ~---rt5.. 050S 060W 4301351030 18440 Indian !OW--!P-_· _____ -+ ______ . __ . _______ -1 

~BAL 9-150-56.__ _ __ ~. __ . __ . ___ ~1-5-- 050S 060W 4301351031 18441 Indian OW :P 
LC TRIBAL 6-28-45 ;28 040S 050W 4301351034 18700 Indian OW iP---c---.--

-~ .. - -- - -- .- =~~__:__t=~-E_'=c==__:__-__t_=__='::__----+:~---- --~~~~--.. -.... -.---
FEOERAL 1-120-65 . .-~~-B 060S 050W 4301351055 18739 Federal OW iP 
FEOERAL 8-120-65 12 060S 050W 4301351056 18718 Federal OW :p 

- -.+~~~~--.-- --------

FEOERAL 2-120-65 .. _ ___ l!L. _ 060S 050W 4301351057 18738 Federal . low =t. ._ ... ___ = 
LC TRIBAL 15-80-56 .....--~.l!--- 050S 060W 4301351060 18862 I Indian. 'g: u ~ _______________ •• ____ ~___I 
LC TRIBAL 8-220-56___~ _ 050S 060W 4301351069 19233 Indian ____._~ __ ~_ 
.!&.TRIBAL 9-170-56 ______ .. 17 050S 060W 4301351070 18945 Indian . lOW P _. __ .. _~~___I 
LC TRIBAL 7-27-45 .~_~__ .127 __ ~ 050W 4301351073 18685 ilndian lOW P_ u • __ ~ __ 

LC TRIBAL 11-24-45 _ .. ___ ~__ ~~. 050W 4301351076 18745 ilndian lOW P 
FEOERAL 3-120-65 _ -~~---------+-!1-. _ 060S 050W 4301351093 18705 Federal .- ,OW P .-. ------.-.. - ------

FEOERAL 4-120-65 ._____ __ ----+-!L--- 060S 050W 4301351094 18704 Federal___ :OW- --IPp.- .. ---~..:::--=----_______ ----
FEOERAL 5-120-65______ -n------f.4 060S 050W 4301351095 18702 Federal lOW .. _ . .. . __ 
FEOERAL 6-120-65 ______~-- 060S 050W 4301351096 18703 Federal OW .. p._ . ___ ~ 
LCTRIBAL9-80-56__ _____ ~ __ .Q1Q~~ 4301351112 18522 Indian __ !OW_. cf.-----.. __ . _~_ 
~mTRIBAL 4-9~54 _ .. ___ .._~~. 050S ;040W 4301351126 19059 Indian OW P .... __ . ____ ----1 

UTETRIBAL6-9-54 ___ ~__ _ ___ ~_~_u 050S040W I4301351127 19017Indian _un QW --cf.-- u_!~_. _____ . __ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 2-9-54 .. ____ . __ 'L._ . 050S j040W i4301351128 118946 +!ndian ____ ~W __ p_.. __ 
UTE TRIBAL 1-10-54 . 10 050S 040W 14301351129 ]18879 :Indian . OW.. 1>. L-~~---_ .. 
LC TRIBAL 8~30D-56~ __ =~---~=~=_jo-~-05oSI060W i4301351131)85391Indi~---~t-ow -. P .-----t 

LC TRIBA~ 16-300-S§.______ ______ ~_ 1050S 1060~:430135!132 :18540 Ilndian_ OW P _- i
n

------==-=_ 
fEOERAL 1-10-65___ ... _____ ____ -+L __ ~60S ,050~ ~30i3s1142 ,18623 Federal__ _ _ OW ___ !' ____ ~ .. , 
~TRIBAL 8-9-?'!___________ _ ___ 19 _ .. j<>?9~1040W.L43_(113511±~ 1 18947 I Indian__ ... :OWn p , .. -~-----.-.---.. -

FEOERAL 15-10-65 _ ~_ __ 1-1 __ ~Q60S ~~ 4301351175 118654 FederaL ____ QW p:=-~_+~~==_~~_~==____== ___ -=-
£~QERAL 16-10-65 ___ ~ __ .. .Jl... _~ t,050W '4301351176 18655 ,Federal. OW P . 
LC TRIBAL 11-290-56 129 1050S i060W:4301351183 18873 I~ ---+ow--p- ·--T-------------

18 
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FEDERAL 5-1D-65 1 060S 050W 4301350761 18174 Federal OW P
FEDEILAL9-2D-65 2 060S 050M' 4301350762 18245 Federal OVV P
FEDEILALll-2D-65 2 060S 050MI 4301350763 18589 Federal ONV P
FEDERAL 15-2D-65 2 060S 050W 4301350764 18590 Federal OW P
LC TTUBAL 14-14D-56 14 050S 0609V 4301350776 18287 Indiam CAW P
LCFEE2-20D-56 20 050S 060TV 4301350777 18622 Fee CA¥ P
LC TRIBAL 12-22D-56 22 050S 060W 4301350780 18341 Indian OW P
FEDEILAL3-4EL65 4 060S 0509V 4301350782 18556 Fedenil ONV P
FEDERAL 6-4D-65 4 060S 050W 4301350783 19162 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 12-4D-65 4 060S 050W 4301350784 19171 Federal OW P
LC TRIBAL 14-15D-56 15 050S 06097 4301350834 18362 Indiam CA¥ P
UTE TRIBAL 7I-21D-54 21 050S 040W 4301350852 18423 Indian OW P BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 8L-21D-54 21 050S 040W 4301350853 18423 Indian OW P BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 10S-21D-54 21 050S 040W 4301350854 18423 Indian OW P BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0
LTTET1tlBAJL 11-11-54 11 050S 040TV 4301350861 18775 Laditui ONV P
LA:ITUO3AUL2-28I3-56 28 050S 0609V 4301350866 18592 Indiani ONV P
LCFEE8-28D-56 28 050S 060TV 4301350867 18342 Fee CON P
LC TRIBAL 6-27D-56 27 050S 060W 4301350868 18480 Indian OW P
LC FEE 15-23D-56 23 050S 0609V 4301350870 18410 Fee OnW P
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8TATE TRIBAL 8-12-55 . _~ 12 0508 050W 4301351188 18986 Indian OW ----t-P----~--~I-il __ _ 
LC TRIBAL 11-20D-56 • 20 __ ~~f"0-"50:",8,-+0~60~W"---I-=4,-",3",-0 ... 13'-'.5 ..... 11~8~9---+-,-,18:,,,8"c19~' In~d~ian~ __ -j.:O",--W~_-----I''-----___ + ________ -----l 
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~~-­~-
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--~-~ I
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lOW P 
,OW P 

.. ---
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--------~. 
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UTE TRIBAL 5-17-55------- ! 17 ~ 0508050W 4301351220 18841 i-=iIn=d=ian"--__ ~__+_"--'-'---+::_~-~- -~-- -------~-
UTE TRIBAL 16-3-54 3 0508 040W 4301351226 18664 Indian OW P I 
8TATE TRIBAL 15-6-54 ~_~~ ___ 6 0508 040W 4301351227 18746 Indian OW P ~·--~.-l--+I-=--=--=--=--=--=~---~------~--__l 
8TATE TRIBAL 8-7-54 7 0508 040W 4301351228 18743 Indian OW P --!-I ____ -------1 

OW P 
OW P 
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

STATE TRIBAL 8-12-55 12 050S 050W 4301351188 18986 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL ll-20D-56 20 050S 060W 4301351189 18819 Indian OW P
LC FEE 5-20D-56 20 050S 060W 4301351190 18818 Fee OW

_

P
LC FEE 9-19-56 19 050S 060W 4301351192 18596 Fee OW P
LC TRIBAL 9-9D-56 9 050S 060W 4301351198 18595 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 16-6-64 6 060S 040W 4301351217 18792 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 9-6D-64 6 060S 040W 4301351218 18791 Federal OW P
UTE TRIBAL 5-17-55 17 050S 050W 4301351220 18841 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 16-3-54 3 050S 040W 4301351226 18664 Indian OW P
STATE TRIBAL 15-6-54 6 050S 040W 4301351227 18746 Indian OW P
STATE TRIBAL 8-7-54 7 050S 040W 4301351228 18743 Indian OW P
STATE TRIBAL 12-1-55 1 050S 050W 4301351229 18741 Indian OW P
STATE TRIBAL 11-2-55 2 050S 050W 4301351230 18742 Indian OW P
FEDERAL 1-11-65 11 060S 050W 4301351231 18689 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 8-11D-65 11 060S 050W 4301351232 18688 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 2-11D-65 11 060S 050W 4301351233 18690 Federal OW P
STATE TRIBAL 12-3-55 3 050S 050W 4301351236 18744 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 11-4-55 4 050S 050W 4301351237 18663 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 4-9-55 9 050S 050W 4301351238 18796 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 15-5-55 5 050S 050W 4301351239 18740 Indian OW P
UTE FEE 9-9-54 9 050S 040W 4301351259 18642 Fee OW P
LC TRIBAL 4-29-45 29 040S 050W 4301351260 18719 Indian OW P
UTE FEE 14-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301351271 18684 Fee OW P
UTE FEE 15-9D-54 9 050S 040W 4301351272 18687 Fee OW P
LC FEE 10-28D-56 28 050S 060W 4301351288 18591 Fee OW P
UTE TRIBAL 8-16D-54 16 050S 040W 4301351295 19003 Indian OW P
FEE TRIBAL 4-5-54 050S 040W 4301351303 19187 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 1-26-56 26 050S 060W 4301351306 18816 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 6-16D-54 16 050S 040W 4301351307 19060 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 7-22D-56 22 050S 060W 4301351308 18795 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 9-22D-56 22 OSOS 060W 4301351309 18794 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 9-32D-56 32 050S 060W 4301351316 19228 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 7-26D-56 26 050S 060W 4301351319 18817 Indian OW P
LC FEE 8-6D-56 050S 060W 4301351342 18657 Fee _ OW P
LC FEE 10-29D-45 29 040S 050W 4301351343 18850 Fee OW P
LC TRIBAL 1-7D-56 7 050S 060W 4301351344 18774 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 9-7D-56 7 050S 060W 4301351346 18773 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL ll-10D-56 10 050S 060W 4301351369 18840 Indian OW P
LC FEE 1-31D-45 31 040S 050W 4301351371 18686 Fee _ OW P
LC TRIBAL 14-21D-56 21 050S 060W 4301351384 18877 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 4-22D-56 22 050S 060W 4301351385 18878 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 8-21D-56 21 050S 060W 4301351392 18874 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-17-55 17 050S 050W 4301351393 18848 Indian OW
LM-33D-45 33 040S 0 4301351401 18855 O_W P
LC TRIBAL 16-21D-56 21 050S 060W 4301351407 18875 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-10D-54 10 050S 040W 4301351411 19172 Indian OW P
Ì T lRIBAL4-10D-54 10 050S 040W 4301351414 190 OW P
LC TRIBAL 2-21D-56 16 050S 060W 14301351418 19252 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 1-23D-45 23 040S 050W 4301351425 18855 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 2-28D-45 28 040S 050W 4301351429 18701 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 9-28D-45 28 040 4301351430 18656 OW P
LC TRIBAL 1-29-56 29 050S 060W 4301351442 18876 Indian OW P
LC FEE 1-1-56 1 OSOS 060W 4301351458 18829 Fee OW P
LC Tribal 12-32-45 32 040S 60W 4301351465 18772 Indian OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-5-54 5 050S 040W 4301351520 18880 Indian OW P
LC Tribal 3-32D-45 32 040S 050W 4301351561 18842 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 5-15D-56 15 S 060W 4301351562 19253 Indian OW P
LC FEE 16-36-56 36 1050S 060W 4301351611 19096 Fee W
LC TRIBAL 15-34-56 34 WOS 060¾01351647 18962 Indian OW P
LC TRIBAL 1-34D-56 0S 060W 4301351660 18988 an OW
LC FEE 13-23-56 23 050S 060W 4301351706 18994 Fee OW P
LC FEE l l-23D-56 23 050S 06Ñ430135170718995 Ìee OW P
LC TRIBAL 3-33-56 33 50S 060W 0ÏŠ5Ï711[19242 Indian OW
LCFEE ll-29D-45 29 04% 050W 4301351743 19188 Fee OW P
LC FEE 4-28D-45 29 040S 050W 4301351745 18849 Fee OW
( C Fee 7R-28-38 28 050S 80W 430135Ï85218863 Fee OW P
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
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FEDERAL 11-7D-64 7 060S 040W 4301351925 19039 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 13-7D-64 7 060S 040W 4301351926 19026 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 14-7D-64 7 060S 040W 4301351927 19040 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-7D-64 7 Ök ÏÃOW Ä30ÏŠŠÏÌ3319141 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 8-7D-64 060S 040W ;4301351934 19142 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 9-7D-64 7 060S R301351935 19143 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 10-7D-64 7 060S NÃOW 4301351936 19144 Feded OW P
ABBOTT FEE 2-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301351949 18974 Fee OW P
ABBOTT FEE 8-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301351950 18964 Fee OW P
ABBOTT FEE 4-6-54 6 050S 040W 4301351952 18965 Fee OW P
Federal 15-12D-65 12 060S 050W 4301351992 19051 Federal OW P
Federal 10-12D-65 12 060S 050W 4301351999 19052 Federal OW P
Federal 9-12D-65 12 060S 050W m352000 19053 Federal OW P
Federal 16-12D-65 12 060S_ 050W 4301 54 Federal OW
Federal 1-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352012 19189 Federal OW P
Federa13-6D-65 6 050W 4301352014 M90 Federal
Federal2-6-65 6 060S 050W Ï301352ÜÏ71919 OW P
Federal 7-6D-65 6 060S 050W 4301352018 19192 ederal OW P
Federal 16-11D-65 11 060S 050W 4301352045 19070 Federal OW P
Federal 15-11D-65 11 060S 050W 4301352046 19076 Federal OW P
Federal 10-11D-65 11 060S 050W 4301352047 19077 Federal OW P
Federal 9-l lD-65 11 060S 050W 4301352048 19071 Federal OW P
Federal 11-12D-65 12 060S 050W 4301352049 19121 Federal OW P
Federal 12-12D-65 12 060S 050W 4301352050 19122 Federal OW P
Federal 13-12D-65 12 060S 050W 4301352052 19123 Federal OW P
Federal 14-12D-65 060S 050W 4301352053 19124 Federal OW P
LC Tribal 12-28D-45 28 040S 050W 4301352089 19378 ndian OW P
LC Tribal 2-32D-45 32 050W 4301352113 19348 Indian OW P
LC Tribal 16-29D-45 32 040S 050W 4301352114 19349 Indian P
Vieira T bal 3-4D-54 050S 040W 4301352145 19210 Indian OW P
Vieira Tribal 5-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352146 19193 Indian P
Vieira Tribal 6-4D-54 4 OSOS 040W 4301352147 19216 Indian OW P
Lamplugh Tribal 6-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352148 19289 Indian OW P
Lamplugh Tribal 5-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352149 19290 Indian GW P
Lamplugh Tribal 4-3D-54 050S 040W 301352150 19291 Indian ¡OW P
Lamplugh Tribal 3-3D-54 0 OW 4301352151 19292 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 6-35D-54 050S 040W 4301352158 19254 Indian GW P
ÜÌÈÌrital 4-Ì5Õ-5 050S 040W 4301352159 19255 Indian W
Heiner Tribal 3-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352165 19194 Indian OW P
HeinerTribal4-ll-54 11 050S 040W 4301352166 19195 Indian OW P
Heiner Tribal 5-l lD-54 11 OSOS 040W 4301352167 19196 Indian BW P
Cog-54 50S 040W 4301352168 19270 Indian OW
Conolly Tribal2-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352169 19197 Indian OW P
C Triba17-llD-54 11 050S 040W 4301352170 19280 OW P
ConollyTribal8-llD-54 11 050S 040W 4301352171 81 Indian
Casper Tribal 1-5D-54 OSOS 040W 4301352180 19198 Indian OW
Fee Tribal 6-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352181 19199 Indian OW P
Fee Tribal 5-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352182 19200 Indian OW P
Fee Tribal 3-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352184 19201 Indian OW P
Casper Triba17-5D-54 5 _ 050S 040W 4301352185 19202 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 10-35D-54 35 050S 040W 4301352198 19320 Indian OW P
U 35 050S 040W 4301352199 11 India GW
UTE Tribal 12-35D-54 050S 040W 4301352200 19312 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 16-35D-54 050S OW 4301352230 19321 Indian P
Evans Tribal 1-3-54 3 050S 52234 19264 Indian OW P
Evans Tribal 2-3D-54 3 _ 050S 040W 4301352235 9265 an
Evans Tribal 7-3D-54 3 050S 9256 Indian OW P
Evans Tribal 8-3D-54 3 1050S 040W 4301352237 19257 ian OW P
Ute Triba19-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352249 19236 Indian
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Federal 10-11D-65 11 060S 050W 4301352047 19077 Federal OW P
Federal 9-l lD-65 11 060S 050W 4301352048 19071 Federal OW P
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Federal 13-12D-65 12 060S 050W 4301352052 19123 Federal OW P
Federal 14-12D-65 060S 050W 4301352053 19124 Federal OW P
LC Tribal 12-28D-45 28 040S 050W 4301352089 19378 ndian OW P
LC Tribal 2-32D-45 32 050W 4301352113 19348 Indian OW P
LC Tribal 16-29D-45 32 040S 050W 4301352114 19349 Indian P
Vieira T bal 3-4D-54 050S 040W 4301352145 19210 Indian OW P
Vieira Tribal 5-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352146 19193 Indian P
Vieira Tribal 6-4D-54 4 OSOS 040W 4301352147 19216 Indian OW P
Lamplugh Tribal 6-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352148 19289 Indian OW P
Lamplugh Tribal 5-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352149 19290 Indian GW P
Lamplugh Tribal 4-3D-54 050S 040W 301352150 19291 Indian ¡OW P
Lamplugh Tribal 3-3D-54 0 OW 4301352151 19292 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 6-35D-54 050S 040W 4301352158 19254 Indian GW P
ÜÌÈÌrital 4-Ì5Õ-5 050S 040W 4301352159 19255 Indian W
Heiner Tribal 3-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352165 19194 Indian OW P
HeinerTribal4-ll-54 11 050S 040W 4301352166 19195 Indian OW P
Heiner Tribal 5-l lD-54 11 OSOS 040W 4301352167 19196 Indian BW P
Cog-54 50S 040W 4301352168 19270 Indian OW
Conolly Tribal2-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352169 19197 Indian OW P
C Triba17-llD-54 11 050S 040W 4301352170 19280 OW P
ConollyTribal8-llD-54 11 050S 040W 4301352171 81 Indian
Casper Tribal 1-5D-54 OSOS 040W 4301352180 19198 Indian OW
Fee Tribal 6-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352181 19199 Indian OW P
Fee Tribal 5-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352182 19200 Indian OW P
Fee Tribal 3-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352184 19201 Indian OW P
Casper Triba17-5D-54 5 _ 050S 040W 4301352185 19202 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 10-35D-54 35 050S 040W 4301352198 19320 Indian OW P
U 35 050S 040W 4301352199 11 India GW
UTE Tribal 12-35D-54 050S 040W 4301352200 19312 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 16-35D-54 050S OW 4301352230 19321 Indian P
Evans Tribal 1-3-54 3 050S 52234 19264 Indian OW P
Evans Tribal 2-3D-54 3 _ 050S 040W 4301352235 9265 an
Evans Tribal 7-3D-54 3 050S 9256 Indian OW P
Evans Tribal 8-3D-54 3 1050S 040W 4301352237 19257 ian OW P
Ute Triba19-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352249 19236 Indian
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F 7 Ï)ÃÕŸV4301351916 Federal
FEDERAL 4-7D-64 7 060S 040W 301351917 1911 Federal OW P
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FEDERAL 8-7D-64 060S 040W ;4301351934 19142 Federal OW P
FEDERAL 9-7D-64 7 060S R301351935 19143 Federal OW P
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Federal 14-12D-65 060S 050W 4301352053 19124 Federal OW P
LC Tribal 12-28D-45 28 040S 050W 4301352089 19378 ndian OW P
LC Tribal 2-32D-45 32 050W 4301352113 19348 Indian OW P
LC Tribal 16-29D-45 32 040S 050W 4301352114 19349 Indian P
Vieira T bal 3-4D-54 050S 040W 4301352145 19210 Indian OW P
Vieira Tribal 5-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352146 19193 Indian P
Vieira Tribal 6-4D-54 4 OSOS 040W 4301352147 19216 Indian OW P
Lamplugh Tribal 6-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352148 19289 Indian OW P
Lamplugh Tribal 5-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352149 19290 Indian GW P
Lamplugh Tribal 4-3D-54 050S 040W 301352150 19291 Indian ¡OW P
Lamplugh Tribal 3-3D-54 0 OW 4301352151 19292 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 6-35D-54 050S 040W 4301352158 19254 Indian GW P
ÜÌÈÌrital 4-Ì5Õ-5 050S 040W 4301352159 19255 Indian W
Heiner Tribal 3-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352165 19194 Indian OW P
HeinerTribal4-ll-54 11 050S 040W 4301352166 19195 Indian OW P
Heiner Tribal 5-l lD-54 11 OSOS 040W 4301352167 19196 Indian BW P
Cog-54 50S 040W 4301352168 19270 Indian OW
Conolly Tribal2-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352169 19197 Indian OW P
C Triba17-llD-54 11 050S 040W 4301352170 19280 OW P
ConollyTribal8-llD-54 11 050S 040W 4301352171 81 Indian
Casper Tribal 1-5D-54 OSOS 040W 4301352180 19198 Indian OW
Fee Tribal 6-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352181 19199 Indian OW P
Fee Tribal 5-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352182 19200 Indian OW P
Fee Tribal 3-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352184 19201 Indian OW P
Casper Triba17-5D-54 5 _ 050S 040W 4301352185 19202 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 10-35D-54 35 050S 040W 4301352198 19320 Indian OW P
U 35 050S 040W 4301352199 11 India GW
UTE Tribal 12-35D-54 050S 040W 4301352200 19312 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 16-35D-54 050S OW 4301352230 19321 Indian P
Evans Tribal 1-3-54 3 050S 52234 19264 Indian OW P
Evans Tribal 2-3D-54 3 _ 050S 040W 4301352235 9265 an
Evans Tribal 7-3D-54 3 050S 9256 Indian OW P
Evans Tribal 8-3D-54 3 1050S 040W 4301352237 19257 ian OW P
Ute Triba19-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352249 19236 Indian
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ZandTUTE TRIBAL 12-~, ____ ~_ '050S 040W 4301331311 11421 Indian u_~~, ___ ~_ , , ___ _ 

UTE TRIBAL 15-17 ___ 17 050S 1040W 4301331649 ~.lndian _ ,!=iOW _...;.§ __ . ____ ,_, ____ ' __ 
UTE TRIBAL 7-30 , ______ , 30 050S 040W 4301332167 12945 ,Indian _ OW S ____ '_ 

~i~ i~:1~ ~~:i~:~5 --==-----1t--- ~~~~ I~~~: :~~!~~;;:~ ,!~~~~ ~:~-=- ~: --=l='~ =- ----." ,,--
FOY TRIBAL 11-34-55 34 050S 050W'4301332351 13648 Indian OW S - - --,-
UTE TRIBAL 13-30-54 =-=-==-~ ,- 1[':::-":" 1050S 040W 4301332409 13968 In~ - - lOW - S - --r--- ---- ~-- --.::: 
UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54,, _____ , __ , 33 _ 1050S 040W 4301332412 13938 ,1ndian_ . ,OW ~- .. d-_u_ ,, ___ "' __ 

UTE TRIBAL 1-20-55 ____ , 20 050S i050W 4301332414 14548 I Indian OW .,,~S _"'_,_ __ ''' ___ ,, __ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 11-30-54 ,30 050S :040W 4301332512 ,13982 Indian OW :S I-":'...:":..'::'...=~~~~"'-'--, ----- ------+-"'--------c-=-:-:'-----t::''' --- ',---,,,,, ------" -

UTE TRIBAL 2-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332569 '114
4
3
33

14
1 

IInnddl~anan ----SOWW ;JfSs, _____ u:,,"-----"------
UTE TRIBAL 10~14-55-----"---~-- 050S 050W 4301332601 
MOON TRIBAL 3-27-54 -- ---- -~- 050S 040W 14301332613 l44i6'fudiaU- --row -- S--- ~,--- --- '~--

,UTE TRIBAL7-21-~ ~ 4} 050S 040W' 4301332623 14383 .Indian. ioW .. ----- S - ':~-----.-. 't" ERRY ... f. I~OT EO. R2ifQ: 
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-55 ______ 24 _ i050S 050W 4301332672 14384 IIndianGW j.L __ ", ______ ''' __ , 
'yTE TRII3AL 7-35~ __ ~ _____ 35 __ 050S 1040W 4301332774 l~ndian ~~IOW __ 2.. ___ ' , ____________ ,_, __ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-54 ___ ",,_ -+"-_ ,050S. 040W 430\332779 '\5078 'IruHan_I __ IS _ _ '. ___ ", _____ ,, ____ 
MOON TRIBAL 13-27-54 __ ___ 27 _ 050S 040W 14301332801 i 15057 Indian _n __ Ow_=T __ ~_u n___ __ _ 

~.~ i~:1~ ~:;!:;l5 __ ---=---=-=----t~~ ~~~~ ~~~: :~~!~~;~~~ ~ =-- ~:~~t==+--j' .-~==--~ ----
J,IThTRIBAL 8-24-54 __ _ ____ 24 __ ~O§"1040W 4301332933 15402 Indian _ ,O~ ____ :.L ____ ." .... ___ u , __ , __ _ 

UTE TRIBAL 12-15-5~________ __ \5 _,<>lQ" ,050W 4301332981 115348 ,lndi~ -Ww . 'S _ .... ___''', ___ _ 
UTE TRIBAL 9-21~5..!.....__ __ __ __,2! 050S ~~01333Q.!<L.li360 tIndian _~n •• OW __ +S ___ ;BERRY PILOT EOR~ 
lITE TRIBAL 15-21-54 __ ,,_______ 21 m __ 050S 104Q~~01333114 ~ii}JIndian ____ ....S2Y1 um_l..S __ n _BE~rr110TEOR24~:Q. 

i~~:i!;::-~-=-=-~el:~ :mml~i:i~i;-li_4_=f==-=--
21 

Berry Petroleum Company, LLCN4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

Ute Tribal 15-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352250 19237 Indian OW P
Ute Triba1 10-3-54 3 050S 040W 4301352251 19238 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 14-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352298 19258 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 12-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352299 19259 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 11-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352300 19260 Indian _ OW P
Ute Tribal 16-4D-54 4 i050S 040W 4301352302 19350 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 15-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352303 19293 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 9-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352305 19304 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 10-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352307 19294 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 2-35D-54 35 050S 040W 4301352319 19322 Indian OW P
UK Tribal 8-35D-54 35 050S 040W 4301352320 19323 Indian OW P
Abbott Fee 5-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352326 19351 Fee OW P
Ute Tribal 6-llD-54 11 050S 040W 4301352330 19243 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 12-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352331 19244 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 14-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352332 19245 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 11-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352343 19305 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 12-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352344 19352 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 13-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352345 19353 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 14-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352346 19306 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 16-5D-54 5 OSOS 040W 4301352545 99999 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 15-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352546 99999 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 10-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352547 99999 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 8-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352548 99999 Indian OW P
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-31 26 120S 070E 4300730987 15218 Fee D PA
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-43 26 120S 070E 4300730990 14922 Fee D PA
SCOFIELD CHRISTIANSEN 8-23 8 120S 070E 4300730999 15172 Fee D PA |
CC FEE 7-28-38 28 030S 080W 4301350887 18288 Fee D PA
CC FEE 8-9-37 9 030S 070W 4301350896 18660 Fee D PA
ST LOST CREEK 32-44 32 110S 070E 4304930023 14450 State D PA
SCOFIELD THORPE 22-41X RIG SKID 22 120S 070E 4300730890 13719 Fee GW S
SCOFIELD-THORPE 35-13 35 120S 070E 4300730991 14846 Fee GW S
SCOFIELD-THORPE 23-31 23 120S 070E 4300731001 14923 Fee GW S
NUTTERS RIDGE FED 5-1 5 060S 040W 4301330403 8231 Federal OW S
WIRE FENCE CYN FED 15-1 15 060S 050W 4301330404 8233 Federal GW S
R FORK ANTELOPE CYN FED 25-1 25 060S 050W 4301330406 8234 Federal OW S
WOLF HOLLOW 22-1 22 060S 050W 4301330425 10370 Federal GW S
ANTELOPE RIDGE 24-1 24 060S 050W 4301330426 10371 Federal OW S
BC UTE TRIBAL 8-21 21 050S 040W 4301330829 8414 Indian OW S BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0;
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 10-21 21 OSOS 040W 4301331283 11133 Indian GW S BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0;
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 12-22 22 050S 040W 4301331311 11421 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 15-17 17 050S 040W 4301331649 11956 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 7-30 30 050S 040W 4301332167 12945 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 8-35-55 35 050S 050W 4301332267 13571 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 10-16-55 16 050S 050W 4301332345 13693 Indian OW S
FOY TRIBAL 11-34-55 34 050S 050W 4301332351 13648 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 13-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332409 13968 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332412 13938 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 1-20-55 20 050S 050W 4301332414 14548 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 11-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332512 13982 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332569 14314 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 10-14-55 14 050S 050W 430133260 14331 Indian OW
MOON TRIBAL 3-27-54 N OSOS 040W 4301332613 14416 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 7-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301332623 14383 Indian OW S BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-55 24 050S 050W 4301332672 14384 Jrulian GW S
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332774 15019 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-54 25 050S 040W 4301332779 15078 Indian OW S
MÖON TRIBAL 13-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332801 15057 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 15-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332855 15114 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 5-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332930 15301 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 8-24-54 24 OS 040W 4301332933 15402 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 12-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332981 15348 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 9-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333040 60 Indian OW BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333114 15441 Indian OW S BERRYPILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 10-16-54 050S 40W Ô0133312 45 Indian OW S
TAYLOR FEE 7-14-56 14 050S 060W 4301333140 15601 Fee OW S
UTE TRIBAL 9S-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301333245 15962 Indian OW S

Berry Petroleum Company, LLCN4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

Ute Tribal 15-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352250 19237 Indian OW P
Ute Triba1 10-3-54 3 050S 040W 4301352251 19238 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 14-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352298 19258 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 12-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352299 19259 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 11-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352300 19260 Indian _ OW P
Ute Tribal 16-4D-54 4 i050S 040W 4301352302 19350 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 15-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352303 19293 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 9-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352305 19304 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 10-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352307 19294 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 2-35D-54 35 050S 040W 4301352319 19322 Indian OW P
UK Tribal 8-35D-54 35 050S 040W 4301352320 19323 Indian OW P
Abbott Fee 5-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352326 19351 Fee OW P
Ute Tribal 6-llD-54 11 050S 040W 4301352330 19243 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 12-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352331 19244 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 14-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352332 19245 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 11-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352343 19305 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 12-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352344 19352 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 13-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352345 19353 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 14-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352346 19306 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 16-5D-54 5 OSOS 040W 4301352545 99999 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 15-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352546 99999 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 10-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352547 99999 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 8-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352548 99999 Indian OW P
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-31 26 120S 070E 4300730987 15218 Fee D PA
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-43 26 120S 070E 4300730990 14922 Fee D PA
SCOFIELD CHRISTIANSEN 8-23 8 120S 070E 4300730999 15172 Fee D PA |
CC FEE 7-28-38 28 030S 080W 4301350887 18288 Fee D PA
CC FEE 8-9-37 9 030S 070W 4301350896 18660 Fee D PA
ST LOST CREEK 32-44 32 110S 070E 4304930023 14450 State D PA
SCOFIELD THORPE 22-41X RIG SKID 22 120S 070E 4300730890 13719 Fee GW S
SCOFIELD-THORPE 35-13 35 120S 070E 4300730991 14846 Fee GW S
SCOFIELD-THORPE 23-31 23 120S 070E 4300731001 14923 Fee GW S
NUTTERS RIDGE FED 5-1 5 060S 040W 4301330403 8231 Federal OW S
WIRE FENCE CYN FED 15-1 15 060S 050W 4301330404 8233 Federal GW S
R FORK ANTELOPE CYN FED 25-1 25 060S 050W 4301330406 8234 Federal OW S
WOLF HOLLOW 22-1 22 060S 050W 4301330425 10370 Federal GW S
ANTELOPE RIDGE 24-1 24 060S 050W 4301330426 10371 Federal OW S
BC UTE TRIBAL 8-21 21 050S 040W 4301330829 8414 Indian OW S BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0;
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 10-21 21 OSOS 040W 4301331283 11133 Indian GW S BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0;
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 12-22 22 050S 040W 4301331311 11421 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 15-17 17 050S 040W 4301331649 11956 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 7-30 30 050S 040W 4301332167 12945 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 8-35-55 35 050S 050W 4301332267 13571 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 10-16-55 16 050S 050W 4301332345 13693 Indian OW S
FOY TRIBAL 11-34-55 34 050S 050W 4301332351 13648 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 13-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332409 13968 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332412 13938 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 1-20-55 20 050S 050W 4301332414 14548 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 11-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332512 13982 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332569 14314 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 10-14-55 14 050S 050W 430133260 14331 Indian OW
MOON TRIBAL 3-27-54 N OSOS 040W 4301332613 14416 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 7-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301332623 14383 Indian OW S BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-55 24 050S 050W 4301332672 14384 Jrulian GW S
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332774 15019 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-54 25 050S 040W 4301332779 15078 Indian OW S
MÖON TRIBAL 13-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332801 15057 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 15-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332855 15114 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 5-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332930 15301 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 8-24-54 24 OS 040W 4301332933 15402 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 12-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332981 15348 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 9-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333040 60 Indian OW BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333114 15441 Indian OW S BERRYPILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 10-16-54 050S 40W Ô0133312 45 Indian OW S
TAYLOR FEE 7-14-56 14 050S 060W 4301333140 15601 Fee OW S
UTE TRIBAL 9S-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301333245 15962 Indian OW S

Berry Petroleum Company, LLCN4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

Ute Tribal 15-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352250 19237 Indian OW P
Ute Triba1 10-3-54 3 050S 040W 4301352251 19238 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 14-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352298 19258 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 12-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352299 19259 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 11-3D-54 3 050S 040W 4301352300 19260 Indian _ OW P
Ute Tribal 16-4D-54 4 i050S 040W 4301352302 19350 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 15-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352303 19293 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 9-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352305 19304 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 10-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352307 19294 Indian OW P
UTE Tribal 2-35D-54 35 050S 040W 4301352319 19322 Indian OW P
UK Tribal 8-35D-54 35 050S 040W 4301352320 19323 Indian OW P
Abbott Fee 5-6D-54 6 050S 040W 4301352326 19351 Fee OW P
Ute Tribal 6-llD-54 11 050S 040W 4301352330 19243 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 12-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352331 19244 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 14-11D-54 11 050S 040W 4301352332 19245 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 11-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352343 19305 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 12-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352344 19352 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 13-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352345 19353 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 14-4D-54 4 050S 040W 4301352346 19306 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 16-5D-54 5 OSOS 040W 4301352545 99999 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 15-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352546 99999 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 10-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352547 99999 Indian OW P
Ute Tribal 8-5D-54 5 050S 040W 4301352548 99999 Indian OW P
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-31 26 120S 070E 4300730987 15218 Fee D PA
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-43 26 120S 070E 4300730990 14922 Fee D PA
SCOFIELD CHRISTIANSEN 8-23 8 120S 070E 4300730999 15172 Fee D PA |
CC FEE 7-28-38 28 030S 080W 4301350887 18288 Fee D PA
CC FEE 8-9-37 9 030S 070W 4301350896 18660 Fee D PA
ST LOST CREEK 32-44 32 110S 070E 4304930023 14450 State D PA
SCOFIELD THORPE 22-41X RIG SKID 22 120S 070E 4300730890 13719 Fee GW S
SCOFIELD-THORPE 35-13 35 120S 070E 4300730991 14846 Fee GW S
SCOFIELD-THORPE 23-31 23 120S 070E 4300731001 14923 Fee GW S
NUTTERS RIDGE FED 5-1 5 060S 040W 4301330403 8231 Federal OW S
WIRE FENCE CYN FED 15-1 15 060S 050W 4301330404 8233 Federal GW S
R FORK ANTELOPE CYN FED 25-1 25 060S 050W 4301330406 8234 Federal OW S
WOLF HOLLOW 22-1 22 060S 050W 4301330425 10370 Federal GW S
ANTELOPE RIDGE 24-1 24 060S 050W 4301330426 10371 Federal OW S
BC UTE TRIBAL 8-21 21 050S 040W 4301330829 8414 Indian OW S BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0;
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 10-21 21 OSOS 040W 4301331283 11133 Indian GW S BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0;
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 12-22 22 050S 040W 4301331311 11421 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 15-17 17 050S 040W 4301331649 11956 Indian OW
UTE TRIBAL 7-30 30 050S 040W 4301332167 12945 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 8-35-55 35 050S 050W 4301332267 13571 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 10-16-55 16 050S 050W 4301332345 13693 Indian OW S
FOY TRIBAL 11-34-55 34 050S 050W 4301332351 13648 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 13-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332409 13968 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54 33 050S 040W 4301332412 13938 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 1-20-55 20 050S 050W 4301332414 14548 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 11-30-54 30 050S 040W 4301332512 13982 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-24-54 24 050S 040W 4301332569 14314 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 10-14-55 14 050S 050W 430133260 14331 Indian OW
MOON TRIBAL 3-27-54 N OSOS 040W 4301332613 14416 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 7-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301332623 14383 Indian OW S BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-55 24 050S 050W 4301332672 14384 Jrulian GW S
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-54 35 050S 040W 4301332774 15019 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-54 25 050S 040W 4301332779 15078 Indian OW S
MÖON TRIBAL 13-27-54 27 050S 040W 4301332801 15057 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 15-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332855 15114 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 5-36-55 36 050S 050W 4301332930 15301 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 8-24-54 24 OS 040W 4301332933 15402 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 12-15-55 15 050S 050W 4301332981 15348 Indian OW S
UTE TRIBAL 9-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333040 60 Indian OW BERRY PILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-54 21 050S 040W 4301333114 15441 Indian OW S BERRYPILOT EOR 246-0
UTE TRIBAL 10-16-54 050S 40W Ô0133312 45 Indian OW S
TAYLOR FEE 7-14-56 14 050S 060W 4301333140 15601 Fee OW S
UTE TRIBAL 9S-25-55 25 050S 050W 4301333245 15962 Indian OW S
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

UTE TRIBAL 9-5-54 5 OSOS 040W 4301351111 18909 Indian OW S
ABBOTT FEE 6-6-54 6 050S 040W 4301351948 18963 Fee OW S

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

UTE TRIBAL 9-5-54 5 OSOS 040W 4301351111 18909 Indian OW S
ABBOTT FEE 6-6-54 6 050S 040W 4301351948 18963 Fee OW S

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC N4075) to Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115)
Effective June 1, 2014

UTE TRIBAL 9-5-54 5 OSOS 040W 4301351111 18909 Indian OW S
ABBOTT FEE 6-6-54 6 050S 040W 4301351948 18963 Fee OW S



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 3lU20t7
FOR]VIER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Linn Operating, Inc.
600 Travis Street, Suite 140

Houston, T){77002

Linn Operating, LLC
600 Travis Street, Suite
Houston, TX77002

140

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Bradford Canyon
Berry PilotEOR246-02
Brundage Canyon

WELL INFORIVIATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entitv Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORIVIER operator on:
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on:
3. New operator Division of corporations Business Number: 9031632-016l

REVIEW:
l. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on:

4/tU20t7
4/tU20t7

4/tuzan

6/13/2017

2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on:
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries:
4. OPS/SVTA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding:
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injectior/storage well(s) approved on:

6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: See Attached List
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request):

4/ly20t7
6/t312017
6lt3l20t7
Per DJJ, not required

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number:
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number:
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s):

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) moved in RBDMS on:

2.Entity Number(s) updated in RBDMS on:
3. Unit(s) update in RBDMS on:
4. Surface Facilities moved in RBDMS on:

5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on:

6. Surface Facilities attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on:

LPM8898781

LPM9149926

K0915367-Blanket
K09515434
K09515409
K09515392
K09622s97
K0g6226ts
K09622ffi3
K09622627

6lruDAn
6lt4l20t7
6lt4l20t7
6lt4/2017
6/1412017

6lt4120t7

COMMENTS:

6/t4/2077

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 3/1/2017
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Linn Operating, Inc. Linn Operating, LLC
600 Travis Street, Suite 140 600 Travis Street, Suite 140
Houston, TX 77002 Houston, TX 77002

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Bradford Canyon
Berry Pilot EOR 246-02
Brundage Canyon

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/11/2017
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/11/2017
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 9031632-0161

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 4/11/2017
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: 4/11/2017
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/13/2017
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 6/13/2017
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: Per DJJ, not required
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: See Attached List
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 6/13/2017

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: LPM8898781
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: LPM9149926
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): KO915367-Blanket

KO9515434
KO9515409
KO9515392
KO9622597
KO9622615
KO9622603
KO9622627

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) moved in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017
2. Entity Number(s) updated in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017
3. Unit(s) update in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017
4. Surface Facilities moved in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017
6. Surface Facilities attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017

COMMENTS:

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 3/1/2017
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Linn Operating, Inc. Linn Operating, LLC
600 Travis Street, Suite 140 600 Travis Street, Suite 140
Houston, TX 77002 Houston, TX 77002

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Bradford Canyon
Berry Pilot EOR 246-02
Brundage Canyon

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/11/2017
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/11/2017
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 9031632-0161

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 4/11/2017
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: 4/11/2017
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/13/2017
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 6/13/2017
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: Per DJJ, not required
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: See Attached List
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 6/13/2017

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: LPM8898781
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: LPM9149926
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): KO915367-Blanket

KO9515434
KO9515409
KO9515392
KO9622597
KO9622615
KO9622603
KO9622627

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) moved in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017
2. Entity Number(s) updated in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017
3. Unit(s) update in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017
4. Surface Facilities moved in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017
6. Surface Facilities attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 6/14/2017

COMMENTS:



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

WellName Sec Town Twp Dir Ranqe Rnq Dir API Entitv Number WellTvpe WellStatus
SWD 4.,I1A2 11 1 S 2 W 430132025s 99990 Water DisposalWell Active
VIRGIL MECHAM 1-11P2. 11 1 S 2 W 4301330009 5760 Water DisposalWell Active
1-3P2 3 1 S 2 W 4301330021 99990 Water DisposalWell Active
BLUEBELL 2-28M 28 1 S 2 W 4301330346 99990 Water DisposalWell Active
SALERATUS 2-17C5 '17 3 S 5 W 4301330388 99990 Water DisposalWell Active
CENTRAL BLUEBELL 2-26M 26 1 S 2 W 4301 330389 99990 Water DisposalWell Active
ZandT UTE TRIBAL 2-21 21 5 S 4 W 4301331280 11130 Water lniection Well Active
ZandT UTE TRIBAL 10-21 21 5 S 4 W 4301331283 11133 Water lniection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL '16-21-54 21 5 D 4 W 4301 332381 13912 Water niection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 7-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332623 14383 Water niection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 12-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332747 '14747 Water niection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 14-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332748 14778 Water niection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 1O-3OD-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301 332893 15246 Water lnjection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 6.30.54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332975 15300 Water lnjection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 9-21.54 2',| 5 S 4 W 4301333040 1 5360 Water lniection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL '15.21-54 21 5 S 4 W 43013331 14 15441 Water lnjec'tion Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 1-2'I-54 2'.| 5 S 4 W 4301 333388 1 5937 Water lniection Well Active
BALLARD 2.158'I 15 2 S ,| W 4304732351 11476 Water DisoosalWell Active
UTE TRIBAL 15-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333623 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13H-9-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301350874 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4H-26-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301350951

4301350974
OilWell Approved Permit

LC TRIBAL 5H-34-45 34 4 S 5 W OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRTBAL 11-34-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301350975 OilWell Approved Permit
cc TRTBAL 4-30D-38 19 3 S 8 W 4301 350993 OilWell Approved Permit
FEDERAL 4-1.65 ,| 6 S 5 W 4301351016 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13H-28-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301351061 OilWell Aporoved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5H-23-45 23 4 S 5 W 430't351071 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4H-2745 27 4 S 5 W 4301351072 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC TRTBAL 16-27-45 27 4 S 5 W 430135',t074 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRTBAL 12-27-45 27 4 S 5 W 4301 351 075 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRTBAL 16-23-45 23 4 S 5 W 4301351077 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 12H-30-56 30 5 S o W 4301 351 1 33 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5H-33-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301 351 338 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC TRIBAL 6.16D.56 16 5 e o W 4301351406 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC TRIBAL 3-14D-56 't4 5 S 6 W 4301 351408 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-6D-57 6 5 S 7 W 430',t35'.t4',t7 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9.2345 23 4 S 5 W 430',t351432 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5-28D.56 29 5 S o W 430135'.t441 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 15-2OD-56 29 5 S 6 W 430135',1443 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 16-33-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351463 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 7-23D-56 23 5 S o W 430135'.t479 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4.7.56 7 5 S 6 W 4301351482 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 3-2-56 2 5 S 6 W 4301351483 OilWell Aporoved Permit
CC TRIBAL 15-34D.38 2 4 S 8 W 4301 351490 Oil Wall Aooroved Permit

6t't4t2017

Well Transfer
2rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
Iffective: 3/1/2017
Well Name Sec Town Twp Dir Range Rng Dir API Entity Number Well Type Well Status
SVVD4-11A2 11 1 S 2 VV 4301320255 99990 \AhderDisposalVVell Active
VIRGIL MECHAM 1M1A2 11 1 S 2 W 4301330009 5760 Water Disposal Well Active
1-3A2 3 1 S 2 VV 4301330021 99990 \AhderDisposalVVell Active
BLUEBELL 2-28A2 28 1 S 2 W 4301330346 99990 Water Disposal Well Active
SALERATUS2-17CS 17 3 S 5 W 4301330388 99990 Water Disposal Well Active
CENTRALBLUEBELL2-26A2 26 1 S 2 W 4301330389 99990 Water Disposal Well Active
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 2-21 21 5 S 4 W 4301331280 11130 Water Injection Well Active
Žand T UTE TRIBAL10-21 21 5 S 4 W 4301331283 11133 Water Injection Well Active
UDE TRIBAL 16-21-54 21 5 S 4 VV 4301332381 13912 VVater Injection VVell Avetive
UTE TRIBAL7-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332623 14383 Water injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL12-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332747 14747 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 14-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332748 14778 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 10-30D-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332893 15246 Water Irgection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 6-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332975 15300 Water injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL9-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301333040 15360 Water InjectionWell Active
UTE TRIBAL15-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301333114 15441 Water InjectionWell Active
UTE TRIBAL1-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301333388 15937 Water InjectionWell Active
BA11]\RD2-15B1 15 2 S 1 VV 4304732351 11476 \NaterDisposalVVell Active
UTE TRIBAL15-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333623 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13H-9-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301350874 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4H-26-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301350951 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5H-34-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301350974 OilWell Approved Permit
L{3_TRIBAL11-34-45 34 4 S 5 VV 4301350975 OilVVell Approved Penviil
CC TRIBAL 4-30D-38 19 3 S 8 W 4301350993 OilWell Approved Permit
FEDERA1.4-1-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301351016 OilVVell Approved Pernlit
LC TRIBAL13H-28-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301351061 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL5H-23-45 23 4 S 5 W 4301351071 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL4H-27-45 27 4 S 5 W 4301351072 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIELAL16-27-45 27 4 S 5 VV 4301351074 OilVVell Approved Penviit
LC TRIBAL 12-27-45 27 4 S 5 W 4301351075 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TTRIELAL16-23-45 23 4 S 5 VV 4301351077 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC TRIBAL 12H-30-56 30 5 S 6 W 4301351133 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL5H-33-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351338 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTRIBAA.6-160-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301351406 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
LCTRIBAJ.3-140-56 14 5 S 6 VV 4301351408 OilVVell AggiovedPermit
LC TRIBAL 13-6D-57 6 5 S 7 W 4301351417 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-23-45 23 4 S 5 W 4301351432 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL5-2BD-56 29 5 S 6 VV 4301351441 OilVVell Approved Pernlit
LC TRIBAL15-20D-56 29 5 S 6 W 4301351443 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal16-33-45 33 4 S 5 VV 4301351463 OilVVell Approved Pernlit
LCTRIELAL7-23D-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301351479 C)ilVVell Approved Pernlit
LC TRIBAL 4-7-56 7 5 S 6 W 4301351482 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL3-2-56 2 5 S 6 W 4301351483 OilWell Approved Permit
CC TRIBAL15-34D-38 2 4 S 8 W 4301351490 OilWell Approved Permit
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Well Transfer
2rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
Iffective: 3/1/2017
Well Name Sec Town Twp Dir Range Rng Dir API Entity Number Well Type Well Status
SVVD4-11A2 11 1 S 2 VV 4301320255 99990 \AhderDisposalVVell Active
VIRGIL MECHAM 1M1A2 11 1 S 2 W 4301330009 5760 Water Disposal Well Active
1-3A2 3 1 S 2 VV 4301330021 99990 \AhderDisposalVVell Active
BLUEBELL 2-28A2 28 1 S 2 W 4301330346 99990 Water Disposal Well Active
SALERATUS2-17CS 17 3 S 5 W 4301330388 99990 Water Disposal Well Active
CENTRALBLUEBELL2-26A2 26 1 S 2 W 4301330389 99990 Water Disposal Well Active
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 2-21 21 5 S 4 W 4301331280 11130 Water Injection Well Active
Žand T UTE TRIBAL10-21 21 5 S 4 W 4301331283 11133 Water Injection Well Active
UDE TRIBAL 16-21-54 21 5 S 4 VV 4301332381 13912 VVater Injection VVell Avetive
UTE TRIBAL7-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332623 14383 Water injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL12-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332747 14747 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 14-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332748 14778 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 10-30D-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332893 15246 Water Irgection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 6-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332975 15300 Water injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL9-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301333040 15360 Water InjectionWell Active
UTE TRIBAL15-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301333114 15441 Water InjectionWell Active
UTE TRIBAL1-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301333388 15937 Water InjectionWell Active
BA11]\RD2-15B1 15 2 S 1 VV 4304732351 11476 \NaterDisposalVVell Active
UTE TRIBAL15-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333623 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13H-9-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301350874 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4H-26-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301350951 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5H-34-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301350974 OilWell Approved Permit
L{3_TRIBAL11-34-45 34 4 S 5 VV 4301350975 OilVVell Approved Penviil
CC TRIBAL 4-30D-38 19 3 S 8 W 4301350993 OilWell Approved Permit
FEDERA1.4-1-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301351016 OilVVell Approved Pernlit
LC TRIBAL13H-28-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301351061 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL5H-23-45 23 4 S 5 W 4301351071 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL4H-27-45 27 4 S 5 W 4301351072 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIELAL16-27-45 27 4 S 5 VV 4301351074 OilVVell Approved Penviit
LC TRIBAL 12-27-45 27 4 S 5 W 4301351075 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TTRIELAL16-23-45 23 4 S 5 VV 4301351077 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC TRIBAL 12H-30-56 30 5 S 6 W 4301351133 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL5H-33-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351338 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTRIBAA.6-160-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301351406 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
LCTRIBAJ.3-140-56 14 5 S 6 VV 4301351408 OilVVell AggiovedPermit
LC TRIBAL 13-6D-57 6 5 S 7 W 4301351417 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-23-45 23 4 S 5 W 4301351432 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL5-2BD-56 29 5 S 6 VV 4301351441 OilVVell Approved Pernlit
LC TRIBAL15-20D-56 29 5 S 6 W 4301351443 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal16-33-45 33 4 S 5 VV 4301351463 OilVVell Approved Pernlit
LCTRIELAL7-23D-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301351479 C)ilVVell Approved Pernlit
LC TRIBAL 4-7-56 7 5 S 6 W 4301351482 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL3-2-56 2 5 S 6 W 4301351483 OilWell Approved Permit
CC TRIBAL15-34D-38 2 4 S 8 W 4301351490 OilWell Approved Permit

1



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

3C TRIBAL 14-35D.38 2 4 S I W 4301 351491 OilWell Approved Permit
3C TRIBAL 8-3D-48 2 4 S 8 W 4301351493 OilWell Aooroved Permit

-c TRTBAL 1-10D-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301 351 510 OilWell Aooroved Permit
rc TRIBAL 3-10D-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301 351 51 1 OilWell Aooroved Permit
tc TRTBAL 7-10D-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301 351 512 OilWell Aooroved Permit
rc TRTBAL 9-29D-56 29 5 S 6 W 4301351513 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 1-16.55 16 5 S 5 W 4301351519 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-17-56 't7 5 s 6 W 4301351704 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal4HW-8-56 8 5 S 6 W 4301351710 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 3-1.ID.56 1',| 5 S 6 W 4301 351 71 3 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 7-11D.56 'l'l 5 S 6 W 43013517',t4 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-34D-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301351717 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4-34D.45 34 4 S 5 W 4301351723 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 7.34D45 34 4 S 5 W 4301351724 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-34D-45 34 4 S 5 W 430',t351747 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 12-31D.56 31 5 S 6 W 4301 351 799 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 8-2OD-56 20 5 S 6 W 4301 351 800 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 6.31D-56 31 5 S 6 W 4301 351 801 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal '11-7D-57 7 5 S 7 W 4301351814 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC Tribal 5-7D-57 7 5 S 7 W 4301 351 81 5 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC Tribal 11-6D-57 6 5 S 7 W 4301 351 81 7 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 8-33-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301 351 859 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC TribalT-23O45 23 4 S 5 W 4301351865 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC Tribal 1-23D-56 23 5 S o W 4301351866 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-19.56 19 5 S 6 W 4301351867 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC TRIBAL 7.19D.56 19 5 S o W 4301351868 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-4D-56 4 5 S b W 4301351869 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 14-32D45 32 4 S 5 W 4301351879 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 7.17D-56 't7 5 S c W 4301351886 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5-17D.56 17 5 S 5 W 4301 351 887 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-2D-56 2 5 S 5 W 4301351893 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-2D-56 2 5 S 6 W 4301351894 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal '15-23D-45 23 4 D 5 W 4301 351 895 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRTBAL 1'l-34D-56 34 5 S c W 4301351900 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9.5D-56 4 5 S 5 W 4301351901 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC Tribal 10-28D-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301 351 903 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-20D.56 20 5 S 6 W 4301351904 OilWell Approved Permit
Ute Tribal 14-17-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301351908 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 14-7D-65 31 5 S 6 W 4301351910 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 3-27D45 27 4 S 5 W 430135191 1 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-34D-56 34 5 S 5 W 4301351914 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-33D-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301 351 939 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 14-33D-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351940 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal '10-27D,45 27 4 S 5 W 4301351941 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC Tribal 14-27D45 27 4 c 5 W 4301 351 951 OilWell Aooroved Permit

6t14t2017

ellTransfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC

·ñective:3/1/2017

CC TRIBAL14-35D-38 2 4 S 8 VV 4301351491 OilVVell Approved Perinit
CC TRIBAL 8-3D-48 2 4 S 8 W 4301351493 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-10D-56 10 5 S 6 VV 4301351510 OilVVell Approved Permit
LCTTilBAL3-10D-56 10 5 S 6 VV 4301351511 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL7-10D-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301351512 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-29D-56 29 5 S 6 W 4301351513 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRIBAL1-16-55 16 5 S 5 VV 4301351519 OilVVell Approved Permit
L(filRIBAd. 1-17-56 17 5 S 6 VV 4301351704 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC fribal4HVV-8-56 8 5 S 6 VV 4301351710 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC TTRIBAJ.3-11D-56 11 5 S 6 VV 4301351713 OilVVell Approved Perinit
LC TRIBAL7-11D-56 11 5 S 6 W 4301351714 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTRIBAL9-3.4D-45 34 4 S 5 VV 4301351717 OilVVell Approved Permit
LCTTRIBAI 4-34D-45 34 4 S 5 VV 4301351723 OilVVell A roved Permit
LC TRÏBAL 7-34D-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301351724 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL13-34D-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301351747 OilWell Approved Permit
LC 17RIBAJ.12-31D-56 31 5 S 6 VV 4301351799 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC TRIBAL8-20D-56 20 5 S 6 W 4301351800 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 6-31D-56 31 5 S 6 W 4301351801 _ OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal11-7D-57 7 5 S 7 VV 4301351814 OilVVell Approved Permit
LCTribal5-7D-57 7 5 S 7 VV 4301351815 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TrÏbal11-6D-57 6 5 S 7 W 4301351817 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 8-33-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351859 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 7-23D-45 23 4 S 5 W 4301351865 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 1-23D-56 23 5 S 6 W 4301351866 OilWell Approved Permit
LC:1TRIBAJ.1-19-56 19 5 S 6 VV 4301351867 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC TRIBAL 7-19D-56 19 5 S 6 W 4301351868 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-4D-56 4 5 S 6 W 4301351869 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 14-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301351879 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTRIBAJ.7-17D-56 17 5 S 6 VV 4301351886 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAd. 5-17D-56 17 5 S 6 VV 4301351887 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-2D-56 2 5 S 6 W 4301351893 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-2D-56 2 5 S 6 W 4301351894 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal15-23D-45 23 4 S 5 VV 4301351895 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 11-34D-56 34 5 S 6 W 4301351900 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-5D-56 4 5 S 6 W 4301351901 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-28D-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301351903 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-20D-56 20 5 S 6 W 4301351904 OilWell Approved Permit
UteTribal14-17-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301351908 OilVVell Approved Pernlit
Federal14-7D-65 31 5 S 6 VV 4301351910 OilVVell Approved Perniit
LCTribal3-27D-45 27 4 S 5 VV 4301351911 OilVVell Approved Permit
LCTRIBAL9-34D-56 34 5 S 6 W 4301351914 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal 10-33D-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351939 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal14-33D-45 33 4 S 5 VV 4301351940 OilVVell Approved Permit
E0Tribal10I-27D-45 27 4 S 5 VV 4301351941 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 14-27D-45 27 4 S 5 W 4301351951 OilWell Approved Permit

2

ellTransfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC

·ñective:3/1/2017

CC TRIBAL14-35D-38 2 4 S 8 VV 4301351491 OilVVell Approved Perinit
CC TRIBAL 8-3D-48 2 4 S 8 W 4301351493 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-10D-56 10 5 S 6 VV 4301351510 OilVVell Approved Permit
LCTTilBAL3-10D-56 10 5 S 6 VV 4301351511 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL7-10D-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301351512 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-29D-56 29 5 S 6 W 4301351513 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRIBAL1-16-55 16 5 S 5 VV 4301351519 OilVVell Approved Permit
L(filRIBAd. 1-17-56 17 5 S 6 VV 4301351704 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC fribal4HVV-8-56 8 5 S 6 VV 4301351710 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC TTRIBAJ.3-11D-56 11 5 S 6 VV 4301351713 OilVVell Approved Perinit
LC TRIBAL7-11D-56 11 5 S 6 W 4301351714 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTRIBAL9-3.4D-45 34 4 S 5 VV 4301351717 OilVVell Approved Permit
LCTTRIBAI 4-34D-45 34 4 S 5 VV 4301351723 OilVVell A roved Permit
LC TRÏBAL 7-34D-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301351724 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL13-34D-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301351747 OilWell Approved Permit
LC 17RIBAJ.12-31D-56 31 5 S 6 VV 4301351799 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC TRIBAL8-20D-56 20 5 S 6 W 4301351800 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 6-31D-56 31 5 S 6 W 4301351801 _ OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal11-7D-57 7 5 S 7 VV 4301351814 OilVVell Approved Permit
LCTribal5-7D-57 7 5 S 7 VV 4301351815 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TrÏbal11-6D-57 6 5 S 7 W 4301351817 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 8-33-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351859 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 7-23D-45 23 4 S 5 W 4301351865 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 1-23D-56 23 5 S 6 W 4301351866 OilWell Approved Permit
LC:1TRIBAJ.1-19-56 19 5 S 6 VV 4301351867 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC TRIBAL 7-19D-56 19 5 S 6 W 4301351868 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-4D-56 4 5 S 6 W 4301351869 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 14-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301351879 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTRIBAJ.7-17D-56 17 5 S 6 VV 4301351886 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAd. 5-17D-56 17 5 S 6 VV 4301351887 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-2D-56 2 5 S 6 W 4301351893 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-2D-56 2 5 S 6 W 4301351894 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal15-23D-45 23 4 S 5 VV 4301351895 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 11-34D-56 34 5 S 6 W 4301351900 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-5D-56 4 5 S 6 W 4301351901 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-28D-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301351903 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-20D-56 20 5 S 6 W 4301351904 OilWell Approved Permit
UteTribal14-17-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301351908 OilVVell Approved Pernlit
Federal14-7D-65 31 5 S 6 VV 4301351910 OilVVell Approved Perniit
LCTribal3-27D-45 27 4 S 5 VV 4301351911 OilVVell Approved Permit
LCTRIBAL9-34D-56 34 5 S 6 W 4301351914 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal 10-33D-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351939 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal14-33D-45 33 4 S 5 VV 4301351940 OilVVell Approved Permit
E0Tribal10I-27D-45 27 4 S 5 VV 4301351941 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 14-27D-45 27 4 S 5 W 4301351951 OilWell Approved Permit

2



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

LC Tribal6-33D.45 33 4 S 5 W 4301 351 955 OilWell Permit
LC Tribal6-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301 351 956 OilWell Permit
Federal 3-1 1 D-65 11 o S 5 W 4301 351982 OilWell Permit
Federal2-4-64 4 o S 4 W 4301 351 983 OilWell Permit
Federal 5-'ll D-65 11 o D 5 W 4301351984 OilWell Permit
FederalT-4D-64 o S 4 W 4301 351 985 OilWell Permit
Federal3-4D-64 o S 4 W 430135't986 OilWell Permit
FederalS-4D-64 o S 4 W 4301351988 OilWell Permit
Federal 6-4D-64 o S 4 W 4301351989 OilWell Permit
Federal 4-4D-64 o S 4 W 4301351991 OilWell Permit
Federal9-4D-64 o S 4 W 4301352004 OilWell Permit
Federal 10-4D-64 4 o S 4 W 430135201 1 OilWell Permit
Federal 1-4D-64 4 o S 4 W 430135202s OilWell Permit
Federal 16-4D-64 4 o S 4 W 43013s2026 OilWell Permit
LC Tribal 10-23D-45 23 4 S 5 W 430',t352029 OilWell Permit
Federal 15-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 430'.t352032 OilWell Permit
Federal9-9D-64 9 6 S 4 W 4301352036 OilWell Permit
Federal 10-9D-64 9 6 S 4 W 4301352041 OilWell Permit
Federal 15-9D-64 I o S 4 W 4301352043 OilWell Permit
Federal 16-9D-64 I 6 S 4 W 4301352044 OilWell Permit
LC Tribal 10-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301352065 OilWell Permit
LC Tribal 16-28D-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301352073 OilWell Permit
LC Tribal 15-24D45 24 4 S 5 W 4301352074 OilWell Permit
LC Tribal 13-17D-56 17 5 S 6 W 4301 352076 OilWell Permit
LC Tribal 15-17D-56 17 5 S 6 W 430',t3s2077 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TribalS-26D-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301352097 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 11-26D-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301 352098 OilWell

OilWell
Approved Permit

LC Tribal4-9D-56 I 5 S 6 W 4301352102 Approved Permit
LC Tribal 8-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301352135 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 15-240-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301352156 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 9-240-54 24 5 S 4 W 43013s21s7 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 1-250-54 25 5 D 4 W 4301352173 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 9-25D-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301352177 Gas Well Aooroved Permit
Myrin Tribal 9-10D-55 't0 5 S 5 W 4301352189 OilWell oved Permit
Myrin Tribal 16-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352190 OilWell oved Permit
Myrin Tribal 10-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352191 OilWell oved Permit
UTE Tribal 1-24D-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301352304 Gas Well oved Permit
UTE TribalT-24D-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301352306 Gas Well oved Permit

TE Tribal 12-25D-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301 352308 Gas Well oved Permit
TE Tribal 4-'l3D-54 13 5 s 4 W 430',t352321 Gas Well oved Permit
TE Tribal 13-25D-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301352322 Gas Well oved Permit
TE Tribal 3-240-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301352347 Gas Well oved Permit
TE Tribal 5-240-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301352348 Gas Well oved Permit
tate Tribal 14-1D-55 ,| 5 S 5 W 4301352372 OilWell oved Permit
tate Tribal 11-1D-55 1 5 S 5 W 4301352373 OilWell Aooroved Permit

6t't4t2017

Well Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective: 3/1/2017
LC Tribal 6-33D-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351955 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 6-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301351956 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal3-11D-65 11 6 Si 5 VV 4301351982 OilVVell Approved Pennit
Fedenal2-4-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301351983 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal 5-11D-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301351984 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 7-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301351985 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 3-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301351986 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal8-4D-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301351988 OilVVell Approved Pennit
Federal 6-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301351989 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal4-4D-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301351991 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal9-4D-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301352004 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
Federal10-4D-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301352011 OilVVell Approved PerrnitI¯ecÏeraÏ1-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301352025 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 16-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301352026 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-23D-45 23 4 S 5 W 4301352029 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal15-4D-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301352032 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
Federal9-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352036 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal10-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352041 OilVVell Approved Perniit
Fedenal15-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352043 OilVVell Afg>rovedPermit
Federal16-90-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352044 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301352065 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal16-2BD-45 28 4 S 5 VV 4301352073 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
LCTribal15-24D-45 24 4 S 5 VV 4301352074 OilVVell Approved Permit
LJDTdbal13-17D-56 17 5 S 6 VV 4301352076 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC Tribal 15-17D-56 17 5 S 6 W 4301352077 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal5-26D-56 26 5 S 6 VV 4301352097 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC Tribal11-260-56 26 5 S 6 VV 4301352098 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC Tritnil4-9D-56 9 5 S 6 VV 4301352102 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LCTribal8-32D-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301352135 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 15-24D-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301352156 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 9-24D-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301352157 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTETribal1-250-54 25 5 S 4 VV 4301352173 Gim;VVell Approved Permit
UTETribal9-25D-54 25 5 S 4 VV 4301352177 GiasVVell Approved Permit

pin Tribal 9-10D-55 10 5 S 5 VV 4301352189 OilVVell Approved Permit
h gin Tribal 16-10D-55 10 5 S 5 VV 4301352190 OilVVell Approved Perniit
MyrinTribal 10-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352191 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETribal1-24D-54 24 5 S 4 VV 4301352304 GasvVell Approved Permit
UTETribal7-24D-54 24 5 S 4 VV 4301352306 Gas\Nell Approved Permit
UTETribal12-25D-54 25 5 S 4 VV 4301352308 Gas\Nell Approved Permit
UTETribal4-13D-54 13 5 S 4 VV 4301352321 Gas½/ell Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 13-25D-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301352322 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTETribal3-24D-54 24 5 S 4 VV 4301352347 Gim;VVell Approved Permit
UTETdbal5-24D-54 24 5 S 4 VV 4301352348 Gian:VVell Approved Permit
StateTribal14-1D-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301352372 OilVVell Approved Permit
StateTribal11-1D-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301352373 OilVVell Approved Permit

3

Well Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective: 3/1/2017
LC Tribal 6-33D-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351955 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 6-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301351956 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal3-11D-65 11 6 Si 5 VV 4301351982 OilVVell Approved Pennit
Fedenal2-4-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301351983 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal 5-11D-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301351984 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 7-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301351985 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 3-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301351986 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal8-4D-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301351988 OilVVell Approved Pennit
Federal 6-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301351989 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal4-4D-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301351991 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal9-4D-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301352004 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
Federal10-4D-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301352011 OilVVell Approved PerrnitI¯ecÏeraÏ1-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301352025 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 16-4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301352026 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-23D-45 23 4 S 5 W 4301352029 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal15-4D-64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301352032 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
Federal9-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352036 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal10-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352041 OilVVell Approved Perniit
Fedenal15-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352043 OilVVell Afg>rovedPermit
Federal16-90-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352044 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301352065 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal16-2BD-45 28 4 S 5 VV 4301352073 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
LCTribal15-24D-45 24 4 S 5 VV 4301352074 OilVVell Approved Permit
LJDTdbal13-17D-56 17 5 S 6 VV 4301352076 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LC Tribal 15-17D-56 17 5 S 6 W 4301352077 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTribal5-26D-56 26 5 S 6 VV 4301352097 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC Tribal11-260-56 26 5 S 6 VV 4301352098 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC Tritnil4-9D-56 9 5 S 6 VV 4301352102 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
LCTribal8-32D-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301352135 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 15-24D-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301352156 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 9-24D-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301352157 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTETribal1-250-54 25 5 S 4 VV 4301352173 Gim;VVell Approved Permit
UTETribal9-25D-54 25 5 S 4 VV 4301352177 GiasVVell Approved Permit

pin Tribal 9-10D-55 10 5 S 5 VV 4301352189 OilVVell Approved Permit
h gin Tribal 16-10D-55 10 5 S 5 VV 4301352190 OilVVell Approved Perniit
MyrinTribal 10-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352191 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETribal1-24D-54 24 5 S 4 VV 4301352304 GasvVell Approved Permit
UTETribal7-24D-54 24 5 S 4 VV 4301352306 Gas\Nell Approved Permit
UTETribal12-25D-54 25 5 S 4 VV 4301352308 Gas\Nell Approved Permit
UTETribal4-13D-54 13 5 S 4 VV 4301352321 Gas½/ell Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 13-25D-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301352322 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTETribal3-24D-54 24 5 S 4 VV 4301352347 Gim;VVell Approved Permit
UTETdbal5-24D-54 24 5 S 4 VV 4301352348 Gian:VVell Approved Permit
StateTribal14-1D-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301352372 OilVVell Approved Permit
StateTribal11-1D-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301352373 OilVVell Approved Permit

3



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

State Tribal 13-1D-55 I 5 S 5 W 43013s2374 OilWell rved Permit
State Tribal 12-20-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301 352391 OilWell rved Permit
State Tribal 14-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352392 OilWell rved Permit
State Tribal 13-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352393 OilWell rved Permit
State Tribal 't4-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352430 OilWell rved Permit
State Tribal 11-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352434 OilWell rved Permit
State Tribal 13-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352435 OilWell rved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 2-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352450 OilWell rved Permit
Ute Tribal 1-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352456 OilWell rved Permit
Ute TribalT-5-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352459 OilWell rved Permit
Ute Tribal 3-16D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352467 OilWell rved Permit
State Tribal 1-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352471 OilWell Permit
State Tribal2-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352472 OilWell Permit
State TribalT-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352473 OilWell Permit
State Tribal 8-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352474 OilWell Permit
Ute Tribal 2-160-54 I 5 S 4 W 4301352481 OilWell Permit
State Tribal 3-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352532 OilWell Permit
State Tribal 4-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352533 OilWell Permit
State Tribal 5-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352s3s OilWell Permit
State Tribal 6-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352536 OilWell Permit
UTE TRIBAL 15.12D.55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352549 OilWell Permit
Ute Tribal 9-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352564 OilWell Permit
UTE TRIBAL 1O-11D.55 1',| 5 S 5 W 4301352566 OilWell Permit
UTE TRIBAL 15-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352567 OilWell Permit
UTE TRIBAL 14.12D.55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352592 OilWell Permit
UTE TRIBAL 13.12D.55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352593 OilWell Permit
UTE TRIBAL ,IO-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352603 OilWell Aooroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 9-11D.54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352604 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL,I5.11-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352605 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 16-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352606 OilWell Aooroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 14-11D.55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352610 OilWell oved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 13-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 430135261 1 OilWell oved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 12-11D.55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352612 OilWell oved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 11-11D-55 't1 5 S 5 W 4301352613 OilWell oved Permit
Federal 6-7D-65 7 S 5 W 4301352682 OilWell oved Permit
Federal 11-7D-65 7 S 5 W 4301352683 OilWell oved Permit
Federal 't0-7D-65 7 S 5 W 4301352684 OilWell oved Permit
FederalT-7D-65 7 S 5 W 4301352685 OilWell red Permit
UTE TRIBAL 4-17D.55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352695 OilWell red Permit
UTE TRIBAL '14-13D-54 13 5 S 4 W 4301352702 OilWell red Permit
State Tribal 3-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 430',t352704 OilWell red Permit
State Tribal 4-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352705 OilWell red Permit
State Tribal 5-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352706 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 6-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 430',t352707 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 8-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352708 OilWell Aooroved Permit

6t14t2017

ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

:ffective: 3/1/2017
StateTübal13-1D-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301352374 C)ilVVell Approved Perrnit
SitateTäbal12-:2D-55 2 5 S 5 VV 4301352391 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
StateTäbal14-2D-55 2 5 S 5 VV 4301352392 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 13-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352393 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 14-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352430 OilWell Approved Permit
SitateTribal11-3D-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301352434 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
State Tribal 13-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352435 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 2-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352450 OilWell Approved Permit
Ute Tribal 1-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352456 OilWell Approved Permit
Ute Tritral7-5-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301352459 OilVVell Approved Perniit
Ute Tribal 3-16D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352467 OilWell Approved Permit
SitateTribal1-3D-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301352471 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 2-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352472 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 7-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352473 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal8-3D-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301352474 OilVVell A roved PermitPP
UteTdbal2-16D-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301352481 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 3-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352532 OilWell ÄpprovedPermit
StateTribal4-3D-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301352533 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
State Tribal 5-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352535 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal6-3D-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301352536 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBAJ.15-12D-55 12 5 S 5 VV 4301352549 OilVVell ApçúovedPermit
Ute Tribal 9-11D-55 11 5 S 5 - W 4301352564 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRIIBAA.10-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352566 OilVVell Approved Permit
UÏE TRIBAL 15-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352567 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 14-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352592 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRllBAI.13-12D-55 12 5 S 5 \N 4301352593 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTE TRIBAL10-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352603 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL9-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352604 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETTRIBAL15-11-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352605 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBAL16-11D-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352606 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBAI.14-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352610 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBA1.13-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352611 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBA1.12-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352612 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBAA.11-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352613 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
Federal 6-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352682 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 11-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352683 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal10-7D-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352684 (3ilVVell Approved Pernlit
Federa17-7D-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352685 (>ilVVell Approved Perniit
UTE TRIBAL4-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352695 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL14-13D-54 _ 13 5 S 4 W 4301352702 __ OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal3-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352704 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 4-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352705 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTdbal5 110-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352706 C)ilVVell Approved Perniit
StateTdbal6-110-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352707 OilVVell Approved Pennit
StateTäbal8-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352708 OilVVell Approved Pennit

4

ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

:ffective: 3/1/2017
StateTübal13-1D-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301352374 C)ilVVell Approved Perrnit
SitateTäbal12-:2D-55 2 5 S 5 VV 4301352391 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
StateTäbal14-2D-55 2 5 S 5 VV 4301352392 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 13-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352393 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 14-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352430 OilWell Approved Permit
SitateTribal11-3D-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301352434 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
State Tribal 13-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352435 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 2-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352450 OilWell Approved Permit
Ute Tribal 1-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352456 OilWell Approved Permit
Ute Tritral7-5-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301352459 OilVVell Approved Perniit
Ute Tribal 3-16D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352467 OilWell Approved Permit
SitateTribal1-3D-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301352471 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 2-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352472 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 7-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352473 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal8-3D-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301352474 OilVVell A roved PermitPP
UteTdbal2-16D-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301352481 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 3-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352532 OilWell ÄpprovedPermit
StateTribal4-3D-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301352533 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
State Tribal 5-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352535 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal6-3D-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301352536 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBAJ.15-12D-55 12 5 S 5 VV 4301352549 OilVVell ApçúovedPermit
Ute Tribal 9-11D-55 11 5 S 5 - W 4301352564 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRIIBAA.10-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352566 OilVVell Approved Permit
UÏE TRIBAL 15-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352567 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 14-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352592 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRllBAI.13-12D-55 12 5 S 5 \N 4301352593 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTE TRIBAL10-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352603 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL9-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352604 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETTRIBAL15-11-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352605 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBAL16-11D-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352606 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBAI.14-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352610 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBA1.13-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352611 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBA1.12-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352612 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTETRIBAA.11-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352613 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
Federal 6-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352682 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 11-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352683 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal10-7D-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352684 (3ilVVell Approved Pernlit
Federa17-7D-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352685 (>ilVVell Approved Perniit
UTE TRIBAL4-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352695 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL14-13D-54 _ 13 5 S 4 W 4301352702 __ OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal3-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352704 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 4-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352705 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTdbal5 110-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352706 C)ilVVell Approved Perniit
StateTdbal6-110-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352707 OilVVell Approved Pennit
StateTäbal8-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352708 OilVVell Approved Pennit

4



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

State Tribal 7-1 1D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301 352709 OilWell Permit
itate Tribal 2-1 1D-55 1',l, 5 S 5 W 4301352710 OilWell Permit
itate Tribal 1-1 1D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352711 OilWell Permit
JTE TRIBAL 9-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 43013s2713 OilWell Permit
itate Tribal2-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352714 OilWell Permit
itate TribalT-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 430',t352715 OilWell Approved Permit
itate Tribal 8-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 43013527',t6 OilWell Approved Permit
JTE TRIBAL 10-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 43013527',17 OilWell roved Permit
JTE TRIBAL 15.4D.55 4 5 S 5 W 43013527',tg OilWell roved Permit
itate Tribal 1-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 43013s2720 OilWell roved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 16-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352721 OilWell roved Permit
State Tribal 3-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352723 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 4-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352724 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 5-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352725 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal6-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352726 OilWell Aoproved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 11-5D.55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352727 OilWell Approved Permj!
UTE TRIBAL 12-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352728 OilWell Aooroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352729 OilWell Aooroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 14-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352730 OilWell rd Permit
State Tribal 15-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352732 OilWell rd Permit
State Tribal 16-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352733 OilWell rd Permit
State Tribal 9-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352735 OilWell rd Permit
UTE TRIBAL 16-3OD-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301 352738 OilWell rd Permit
Myrin Tribal9-19D-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301 352739 OilWell Permit
State Tribal 16-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352740 OilWell Permit
State Tribal 15-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 430135274',1 OilWell Permit
State Tribal 10-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W

W
4301352742 OilWell Approved Permit

State Tribal 9-3D-55 3 5 S 5 43013s2743 OilWell Approved Permit
Myrin Tribal 15-19D-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301352744 OilWell Aporoved Permit
Myrin Tribal 13-19D-55 19 5 S 5 W 430'.t352745 OilWell Approved Permit
Myrin Tribal 12-19D-55 19 5 S 5 W 430',t352746 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 5-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352747 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 4-4D.55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352748 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 3-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352749 OilWell Approvepllqrn!!!
UTE TRIBAL 6-4D.55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352754 OilWell Approved !e1m1t
UTE TRIBAL 7.31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352764 OilWell Approved Permit
Myrin Tribal 11-19D-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301 352765 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 4-3OD-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301 352796 OilWell Aooroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 5-3OD-55 30 5 S 5 W 43013s2797 OilWell lved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 7-3OD-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301 352799 OilWell lved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 1-3OD-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301 352809 OilWell lved Permit
LC TRIBAL 6.25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 35281 0 OilWell lved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352812 OilWell rved Permit
Federal 6-13D-65 13 o S 5 W 4301352813 OilWell lved Permit
Federal 4-13D-65 13 6 S 5 W 4301352814 OilWell Aooroved Permit

6t14t2017

Nell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.

fo: Linn Operation, LLC
Nective:3/1/2017

State Tribal 7-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352709 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal2-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352710 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 1-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352711 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 9-4D-55 4 5 S 5 _ W 4301352713 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal2-10D-55 10 5 S 5 VV 4301352714 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
StateTribal7-10D-55 10 5 S 5 VV 4301352715 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
State Tribal8-10D-55 10 5 S 5 VV 4301352716 OilVVell Approved Pennit
UTE TRIBAL 10-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352717 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRIBAL 15-4D-55 4 5 S 5 VV 4301352718 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 1-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352720 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL16-4D-55 4 5 S 5 VV 4301352721 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
State Tribal 3-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352723 OilWell Approved Permit
State Triba 4-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352724 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal5-10D-55 10 5 S 5 \N 4301352725 OilVVell A.pprovedPermit
State Tribal 6-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352726 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL11-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352727 OilWell Aggroved Permit
UTETRIBAL12-5D-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301352728 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352729 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 14-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352730 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 15-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352732 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal16-2D-55 2 5 S 5 VV 4301352733 OilVVell Aly>rovedPermit
StateTäbal9-2D-55 2 5 S 5 VV 4301352735 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL16;-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352738 OilVVell Approved Permit
MydnTribal9-19D-55 19 5 S 5 VV 4301352739 OilVVell Approved Permit
StateTribal16-3D-55 3 5 S 5 \N 4301352740 OilVVell Apgroved Permit
State Tribal 15-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352741 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 10-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352742 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 9-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352743 OilWell Approved Permit
MyrinTribal15-19D-55 19 5 S 5 \N 4301352744 OilVVell Approved Permit
MyrinTribal 13-19D-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301352745 OilWell Approved Permit
MyrinTribal12-19D-55 19 5 S 5 VV 4301352746 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTE TRIBAL 5-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352747 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL4-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352748 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL3-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352749 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL6-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352754 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL7-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352764 OilWell Approved Permit
MyrinTribal 11-19D-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301352765 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 4-30D-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352796 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 5-30D-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352797 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRIBA1.7-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352799 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTETRIBAI.1-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352809 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 6-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352810 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352812 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal6-13D-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352813 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal4-13D-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352814 OilVVell Approved Perrnit

5

Nell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.

fo: Linn Operation, LLC
Nective:3/1/2017

State Tribal 7-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352709 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal2-11D-55 11 5 S 5 VV 4301352710 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 1-11D-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301352711 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 9-4D-55 4 5 S 5 _ W 4301352713 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal2-10D-55 10 5 S 5 VV 4301352714 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
StateTribal7-10D-55 10 5 S 5 VV 4301352715 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
State Tribal8-10D-55 10 5 S 5 VV 4301352716 OilVVell Approved Pennit
UTE TRIBAL 10-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352717 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRIBAL 15-4D-55 4 5 S 5 VV 4301352718 OilVVell Approved Permit
State Tribal 1-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352720 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL16-4D-55 4 5 S 5 VV 4301352721 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
State Tribal 3-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352723 OilWell Approved Permit
State Triba 4-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352724 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal5-10D-55 10 5 S 5 \N 4301352725 OilVVell A.pprovedPermit
State Tribal 6-10D-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301352726 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL11-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352727 OilWell Aggroved Permit
UTETRIBAL12-5D-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301352728 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352729 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 14-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352730 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 15-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352732 OilWell Approved Permit
StateTribal16-2D-55 2 5 S 5 VV 4301352733 OilVVell Aly>rovedPermit
StateTäbal9-2D-55 2 5 S 5 VV 4301352735 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL16;-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352738 OilVVell Approved Permit
MydnTribal9-19D-55 19 5 S 5 VV 4301352739 OilVVell Approved Permit
StateTribal16-3D-55 3 5 S 5 \N 4301352740 OilVVell Apgroved Permit
State Tribal 15-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352741 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 10-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352742 OilWell Approved Permit
State Tribal 9-3D-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301352743 OilWell Approved Permit
MyrinTribal15-19D-55 19 5 S 5 \N 4301352744 OilVVell Approved Permit
MyrinTribal 13-19D-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301352745 OilWell Approved Permit
MyrinTribal12-19D-55 19 5 S 5 VV 4301352746 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTE TRIBAL 5-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352747 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL4-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352748 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL3-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352749 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL6-4D-55 4 5 S 5 W 4301352754 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL7-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352764 OilWell Approved Permit
MyrinTribal 11-19D-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301352765 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 4-30D-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352796 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 5-30D-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352797 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRIBA1.7-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352799 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTETRIBAI.1-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352809 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 6-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352810 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352812 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal6-13D-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352813 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal4-13D-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352814 OilVVell Approved Perrnit

5



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

Federal 3-13D-65 13 c S 5 W 4301 35281 5 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 3-16D-64 16 , S 4 W 4301 352823 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 4-16D-64 16 c S 4 W 430'.t352824 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 5-16D-64 16 J S 4 W 4301352825 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 6-16D-64 16 6 S 4 W 43013s2826 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 5-13D-65 13 6 S 5 W 4301352827 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1.25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 352835 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC TRTBAL 2-25D,-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 352836 OilWell Aporoved Permit
LC TRIBAL 8.25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 352837 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 352840 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRTBAL 15-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352844 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal9-5D-65 5 6 S 5 W 4301 352846 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 10-5D-65 5 6 S 5 W 4301352847 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 16-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 352848 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 10.25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 352849 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 8.30D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301 352855 OilWell Aooroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 9-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301 352870 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 6-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301352871 OilWell Aooroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 16-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352872 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal9-8D-64 I b S 4 W 4301 352880 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 16-8D-64 I o S 4 W 4301352881 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 13-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301 352882 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 4-29D.55 29 5 S 5 W 4301352883 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 1-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301 352884 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal4-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301 352885 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal5-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301 352886 OilWell Aooroved Permit
Federal 12-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301352887 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 12-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 352888 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 352890 OilWell Permit
LC TRIBAL 14.25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 352891 OilWell Permit
Federal 15-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301 352892 OilWell Permit
Federal 9-3D-65 3 b S 5 W 4301 352893 OilWell Permit
FederalS-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301 352894 OilWell Permit
Federal6-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301352895 OilWell Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 6-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301 352896 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 2-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352897 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 4-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352898 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 5-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352899 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE FEE 13-9D.54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352906 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE FEE 2-34D-55 5 S 5 W 4301352971 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 13-7D-65 6 S 5 W 4301352974 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 14-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 43013s297s OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 6-27D-55 5 S 5 W 4301352976 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen'l ribal 12-27D-56 5 S o W 4301352977 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 13-27D-56 27 5 S o W 4301352978 OilWell Aoproved Permit

6t14t2017

ell Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective: 3/1/2017
Federal 3-13D-65 13 6 S 5 W 4301352815 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 3-16D-64 16 6 S 4 W 4301352823 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 4-16D-64 16 6 S 4 W 4301352824 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 5-16D-64 16 6 S 4 W 4301352825 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 6-16D-64 16 6 S 4 W 4301352826 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 5-13D-65 13 6 S 5 W 4301352827 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352835 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 2-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352836 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 8-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W _ 4301352837 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352840 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL15-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352844 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 9-50-65 5 6 S 5 W __ 4301352846 OilWell Aggroved Permit
Federal 10-5D-65 5 6 S 5 W 4301352847 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 16-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352848 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL10-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352849 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 8-30D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301352855 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL9-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301352870 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL6-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301352871 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL16-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352872 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 9-8D-64 9 6 S 4 W 4301352880 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 16-8D-64 9 6 S 4 W 4301352881 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 13-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301352882 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL4-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301352883 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL1-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301352884 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 4-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301352885 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 5-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301352886 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 12-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301352887 OilWell A roved PermitPP
LC TRIBAL12-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352888 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352890 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 14-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352891 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 15-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 430iŠ52892 OilWell _ Approved Permit
Federal 9-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301352893 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 8-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301352894 OilWell _ Approved Permit
Federal 6-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301352895 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 6-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352896 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 2-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352897 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 4-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352898 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 5-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352899 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE FEE 13-9D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352906 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE FEE 2-34D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301352971 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 13-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352974 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 14-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352975 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 6-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301352976 OilWell
LC Nielsen Tribal 12-27D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301352977 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 13-27D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301352978 OilWell Approved Permit

6

ell Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective: 3/1/2017
Federal 3-13D-65 13 6 S 5 W 4301352815 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 3-16D-64 16 6 S 4 W 4301352823 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 4-16D-64 16 6 S 4 W 4301352824 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 5-16D-64 16 6 S 4 W 4301352825 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 6-16D-64 16 6 S 4 W 4301352826 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 5-13D-65 13 6 S 5 W 4301352827 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352835 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 2-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352836 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 8-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W _ 4301352837 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352840 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL15-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352844 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 9-50-65 5 6 S 5 W __ 4301352846 OilWell Aggroved Permit
Federal 10-5D-65 5 6 S 5 W 4301352847 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 16-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352848 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL10-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352849 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 8-30D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301352855 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL9-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301352870 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL6-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301352871 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL16-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352872 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 9-8D-64 9 6 S 4 W 4301352880 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 16-8D-64 9 6 S 4 W 4301352881 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 13-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301352882 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL4-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301352883 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL1-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301352884 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 4-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301352885 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 5-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301352886 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 12-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301352887 OilWell A roved PermitPP
LC TRIBAL12-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352888 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352890 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 14-25D-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301352891 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 15-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 430iŠ52892 OilWell _ Approved Permit
Federal 9-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301352893 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 8-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301352894 OilWell _ Approved Permit
Federal 6-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301352895 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 6-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352896 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 2-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352897 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 4-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352898 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 5-33D-56 33 5 S 6 W 4301352899 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE FEE 13-9D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352906 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE FEE 2-34D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301352971 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 13-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352974 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 14-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352975 OilWell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 6-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301352976 OilWell
LC Nielsen Tribal 12-27D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301352977 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 13-27D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301352978 OilWell Approved Permit

6



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

LC Nielsen Tribal 16-28D-56 27 5 S o W 4301352979 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Fee 9-28D-56 27 5 S o W 4301352980 OilWell Approved Permit
LC FEE 9-36D-56 36 5 S E W 4301352982 OilWell Approved Permit
LC FEE 15-36D-56 36 5 S c W 4301352983 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 6.36D-56 36 5 S o W 4301352984 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5-36D.56 36 5 S o W 4301352985 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4-36D-56 36 5 S c W 4301352986 OilWell Aporoved Permit
LC TRIBAL 3-36D-56 36 5 S c W 43013s2987 OilWell roved Permit
LC TRIBAL 2-35D-56 35 5 S c W 4301 352988 OilWell roved Permit
rc TRTBAL 1-35D-56 35 5 S ) W 4301 352989 OilWell roved Permit
rc TRTBAL 9-35D-56 35 5 S 5 W 430'1353018 OilWell roved Permit
] TRIBAL 6.35D.56 35 5 S 6 W 4301353019 OilWell roved Permit

TRIBAL 1O-35D-56 35 5 S c W 4301353020 OilWell roved Permit
TE TRIBAL 9.17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301353022 OilWell roved Permit

TRIBAL 8.35D-56 35 5 S 5 W 4301353023 OilWell roved Permit
TE TRIBAL 1O-17D.55 17 5 S 5 W 430',t353024 OilWell roved Permit

LC TRIBAL 7-35D-56 35 5 S tt W 4301353025 OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5-35D-56 35 5 S c W 4301353026 OilWell Approved Permit
rc TRTBAL 1s-35D-56 35 5 S c W 4301353027 OilWell Approved Permit
rc TRTBAL 16-35D-56 35 5 S , W 4301353028 OilWell Approved Permit
rc TRTBAL 3-35D-56 35 5 S c W 4301353029 OilWell Approved Permit
rc TRTBAL 4-35D-56 35 5 S

S
t W 4301353030 OilWell Approved Permit

rc TRTBAL 14-35D-56 35 5 , W 4301353036 OilWell Approved Permit
tC TRIBAL 13.35D.56 35 5 S 6 W 4301353038 OilWell Aoproved Permit
tc TRTBAL 12-35D-56 35 5 S 6 W 4301353039 OilWell Approved Permit
rc TRTBAL 11-35D-56 35 5 S 6 W 4301353040 OilWell Aooroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 8-14D-55 't4 5 S 5 W 4301 353099 OilWell Approved Permit
rc FEE 13-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301353't14 OilWell Aoproved Permit
rc FEE 11-36D-56 36 5 S o W 43013531'ts OilWell Aooroved Permit
LC Nielsen Fee 15-28D-56 28 5 S 6 W 4301 3531 31 OilWell Aooroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 3-20D.55 20 5 S 5 W 4301 333280 18424 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 4H-17-56 't7 5 S 6 W 4301 333540 18067 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 8-2OD-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333676 17308 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
JTE TRIBAL 14JI4D-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301333699 18409 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
JTE TRIBAL 5.29D.55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333740 17306 OilWell Q4!!iqg*o,p_el4io1pSg5p-qQepl

Drilling Operations SuspendedJTE TRIBAL 7-32D-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333794 18359 OilWell
JTE TRIBAL 12-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301 333798 18360 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended

IRY TRIBAL 2.23D.54 23 5 S 4 /V 4301 333805 18546 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
: TRIBAL 13-29D.55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333807 18378 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended

TRIBAL 16-28D.55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333887 18594 OilWell Drillins Operations Suspended
)ERAL 10-10D-65 10 6 S 5 W 4301350523 19773 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
FEE 8-15D-56 15 5 S o W 4301350597 19347 OilWell Drillino Ooerations Susoended
ru FEE'13-10D-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301350892 19186 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended

SFW TRIBAL 11-1OD-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301 350893 19215 OilWell Drillinq Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 16-34D-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301350977 18658 Oil Well Drillina Onarafions Srrsnender|
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ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective:3/1/2017
LC Nielsen Tribal 16-28D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301352979 OilWell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Fee 9-28D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301352980 OilWell Approved Permit
LC FEE 9-36D-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301352982 OilVVell Approved PinTnit
LC FEE 15-36D-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301352983 OilVVell A roved PermitPP
LC TTRIELAL6-36D-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301352984 OilVVell Approved Perniit
LC TRIBAL 5-36D-56 36 5 S |6 W 4301352985 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL4-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301352986 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIELAL3-36D-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301352987 OilVVell Approved Perrylit
LC TRIBAL2-35D-56 35 5 S 6 W 4301352988 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTRIBAL1-35D-56 35 5 S 6 VV 4301352989 OilVVell A roved PermitPP
LC TTRIBAL9-35D-56 35 5 S 6 VV 4301353018 OilVVell Approved Perttiit
LC TRIBAL6-35D-56 35 5 S 6 W 4301353019 OilWell Approved Permit
LCTFUBAL 10-35D-56 35 5 S 6 VV 4301353020 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTETRIBAL9-17D-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301353022 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 8-35D-56 35 5 S 6 W 4301353023 OilWell Approved Permit
UTETRIBAL 10-17D-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301353024 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL7-35D-56 35 5 S 6 W 4301353025 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL5-35D-56 35 5 S 6 W 4301353026 OilWell Approved Permit
LC 11RIBAd.15-35D-56 35 5 S 6 \A/ 4301353027 OilVVell Approved Perniit
LCTRIELAL 16-35D-56 35 5 S 6 \Al 4301353028 OilVVell Approved Pertviit
LC TRIBAL3-35D-56 35 5 S 6 W 4301353029 OilWell Approved Permit
LC TTRIELAL4-35D-56 35 5 S 6 VV 4301353030 OilVVell Approved Perrilit
LC 11RIBAd.14-35D-56 35 5 S 6 VV 4301353036 OilVVell Approved Perniit
LCTRIELAL 13-35D-56 35 5 S 6 VV 4301353038 OilVVell Approved Perniit
LC TRIELAL12-35D-56 35 5 S 6 VV 4301353039 OilVVell Approved Perrylit
LC TRIBAL11-35D-56 35 5 S 6 VV 4301353040 OilVVell ApprovedPennit
UTE TRIBAL8-14D-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301353099 OilWell _ Approved Permit
LC FEE 13-36D-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301353114 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC FEE 11-36D-56 36 5 S 6 \N 4301353115 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Fee 15-28D-56 28 5 S 6 VV 4301353131 (3ilVVell Approved Pertilit
UTE TRIBAL 3-20D-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333280 18424 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 4H-17-56 17 5 S 6 W _ 4301333540 18067 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 8-20D-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333676 17308 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL14-14D-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301333699 18409 OilWell _ DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL5-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333740 17306 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 7-32D-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333794 18359 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 12-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301333798 18360 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
BERRY TRIBAL 2-23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333805 18546 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 13-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333807 18378 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL16-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333887 18594 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
FEDERAL 10-10D-65 10 6 S 5 W 4301350523 19773 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
LC FEE 8-15D-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301350597 19347 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
SFW FEE 13-10D-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301350892 19186 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
SF\A/TRIELAL11-10D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301350893 19215 OilVVell Drilling (3perations Suspended
LC TRIBAL16-34D-45 34 4 S |5 W 4301350977 18658 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
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rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective:3/1/2017
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

LC TRIBAL 5-29D.56 29 5 S o W 4301 351 1 84 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 2-33D45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351402 18854 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 9-24D45 24 4 D 5 W 4301351431 18861 OilWell Drillino Ooerations Susoended
LC TRIBAL 9.3D.56 3 5 S o W 4301 351 514 18948 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
GALLOWAY #2-'14B.2 14 2 S 2 W 4301 351739 '19044 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC Tribal3-34D-56 34 5 S 6 W 4301352087 't9234 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TribalT-34D-56 34 5 S o W 4301352088 1 9235 OilWell Drillins Operations Suspended
Ute Tribal 5-9D-54 I 5 S 4 W 4301352463 19354 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
Ute Tribal3-gD-54 I 5 S 4 W 4301352464 1 9355 OilWell Drillins Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 7-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352691 19691 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 6-17D-55 't7 5 S 5 W 4301352692 1 9708 OilWell Drillino Ooerations Susoended
UTE TRIBAL 3.17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352693 19709 OilWell

@
Drilling Operations Suspended

UTE TRIBAL 2-17D-55 't7 5 S 5 W 4301352694 19692 OilWell
State Tribal3-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 430',t352697 19667 OilWell
State Tribal 4-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352698 19668 OilWell
State Tribal 10-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352734 19710 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 1.36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301353021 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 8-36D-56 36 5 S o W 4301 353034 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 7.36D.56 36 5 S 6 W 4301 353035 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 2-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301 353037 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 13-17D-55 ',7 5 S 5 W 4301 333550 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL '11-14D.54 14 5 S 4 W 4301 333596 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 16-17D.55 '17 5 S 5 W 4301333622 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 14-16D.56 16 5 S o W 4301334283 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 3-23D-56 23 5 S 6 W 4301350624 OilWell Location Abandoned
FEDERAL 2.1D-64 1 6 S 4 W 4301350765 OilWell Location Abandoned
FEDERAL 7.1D-64 1 o S 4 W

W
43013 07!q
4301350767

OilWell Location Abandoned
FEDERAL 9-1D-64 1 6 S 4 OilWell Location Abandoned
cc FEE 8-24-38 24 3 S 8 W 4301350885 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC FEE 4HJt2-57 12 5 S 7 W 4301350952 OilWell Location Abandoned
cc TRTBAL 4-2-48 2 4 S 8 W 4301350964 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 7.2D-56 2 5 S 6 W 4301 350988 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 10.18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301350989 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 3.16D.56 16 5 S EI W 4301351032 OilWell Location Abandoned
cc FEE 6-21-38 21 3 S 8 W 4301351059 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 12H-19-56 19 5 S 6 W 4301351 193 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC FEE 15-1 1D-56 11 5 S 6 W 4301351 197 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 13H-10-56 11 5 S 6 W 4301 351209 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 2-3'ID-45 31 4 S 5 W 4301 351261 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 13H.24.45 24 4 S 5 W 4301351273 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 6.21D.55 21 5 S 5 W 430135',t274 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 15.16D-55 16 5 S 5 W 430135',t284 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 4H-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301351292 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 13H-14.54 14 5 S 4 W 4301351297 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 'I-32-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301351298 OilWell Location Abandoned
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Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
Ëffective: 3/1/2017
LC TRIBAL5-29D-56 29 5 S 6 W 4301351184 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 2-33D-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351402 18854 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 9-24D-45 24 4 S 5 W 4301351431 18861 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 9-3D-56 3 5 S 6 W 4301351514 18948 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
GALLOWAY #2-14B2 14 2 S 2 W 4301351739 19044 OilWell _ _ DrillingOperations Suspended
LCTribal3-34D-56 34 5 S 6 VV 4301352087 19234 OilViell DdilingOperationsSuspended
LCTribal7-34D-56 34 5 S 6 VV 4301352088 19235 OilVVell DrillingOperations Suspended
Ute Tribal 5-9D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352463 19354 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
Ute Tribal 3-9D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352464 19355 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL7-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352691 19691 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL6-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352692 19708 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL3-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352693 19709 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 2-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352694 19692 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
State Tribal 3-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352697 19667 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
State Tribal 4-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352698 19668 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
State Tribal 10-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352734 19710 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 1-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301353021 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 8-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301353034 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL7-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301353035 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL2-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301353037 OilWell _ DrillingOperations Suspended
UTETRIBAL13-17D-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301333550 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTETRIBAL11-14D-54 14 5 S 4 VV 4301333596 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTETTRIELAL16-17D-55 17 5 S 5 \N 4301333622 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIELAL14-16D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301334283 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIELAL3-23D-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301350624 OilVVell Location Abandoned
FEDERAd.2-1D-64 1 6 S 4 VV 4301350765 OilVVell Location Abandoned
FEDEFLAL7-1D-64 1 6 S 4 VV 4301350766 OilVVell Location Abandoned
FEDEFLAL9-10-64 1 6 S 4 \4 4301350767 OilVVell Location Abandoned
CC FEE8-24-38 24 3 S 8 VV 4301350885 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC FEE4H-12-57 12 5 S 7 VV 4301350952 OilVVell Location Abandoned
DCTTilBAL4-2-48 2 4 S 8 VV 4301350964 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTRIBAL7-2D-56 2 5 S 6 VV 4301350988 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTRIBAL10-18D-56 18 5 S 6 VV 4301350989 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC TTRIELAL3-16D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301351032 OilVVell Location Abandoned
CC FEE6-21-38 21 3 S 8 VV 4301351059 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC TTRIELAL12H-19-56 19 5 S 6 VV 4301351193 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC FEE 15-11D-56 11 5 S 6 VV 4301351197 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC TTilBAL13H-10-56 11 5 S 6 VV 4301351209 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTRIBAL2-31D-45 31 4 S 5 VV 4301351261 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTRIBAL13H-24-45 24 4 S 5 VV 4301351273 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTETRIBAL6-21D-55 21 5 S 5 VV 4301351274 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTETTRIELAL15-16D-55 16 5 S 5 VV 4301351284 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAI.4H-15-55 15 5 S 5 VV 4301351292 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAI.13H-14-54 14 5 S 4 VV 4301351297 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAI.1-32-55 32 5 S 5 VV 4301351298 OilVVell Location Abandoned
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Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
Ëffective: 3/1/2017
LC TRIBAL5-29D-56 29 5 S 6 W 4301351184 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
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LC TRIBAL 9-3D-56 3 5 S 6 W 4301351514 18948 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
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LCTribal3-34D-56 34 5 S 6 VV 4301352087 19234 OilViell DdilingOperationsSuspended
LCTribal7-34D-56 34 5 S 6 VV 4301352088 19235 OilVVell DrillingOperations Suspended
Ute Tribal 5-9D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352463 19354 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
Ute Tribal 3-9D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352464 19355 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL7-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352691 19691 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL6-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352692 19708 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL3-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352693 19709 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 2-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301352694 19692 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
State Tribal 3-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352697 19667 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
State Tribal 4-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352698 19668 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
State Tribal 10-2D-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301352734 19710 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 1-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301353021 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 8-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301353034 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL7-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301353035 OilWell DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL2-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301353037 OilWell _ DrillingOperations Suspended
UTETRIBAL13-17D-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301333550 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTETRIBAL11-14D-54 14 5 S 4 VV 4301333596 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTETTRIELAL16-17D-55 17 5 S 5 \N 4301333622 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIELAL14-16D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301334283 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIELAL3-23D-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301350624 OilVVell Location Abandoned
FEDERAd.2-1D-64 1 6 S 4 VV 4301350765 OilVVell Location Abandoned
FEDEFLAL7-1D-64 1 6 S 4 VV 4301350766 OilVVell Location Abandoned
FEDEFLAL9-10-64 1 6 S 4 \4 4301350767 OilVVell Location Abandoned
CC FEE8-24-38 24 3 S 8 VV 4301350885 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC FEE4H-12-57 12 5 S 7 VV 4301350952 OilVVell Location Abandoned
DCTTilBAL4-2-48 2 4 S 8 VV 4301350964 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTRIBAL7-2D-56 2 5 S 6 VV 4301350988 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTRIBAL10-18D-56 18 5 S 6 VV 4301350989 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC TTRIELAL3-16D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301351032 OilVVell Location Abandoned
CC FEE6-21-38 21 3 S 8 VV 4301351059 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC TTRIELAL12H-19-56 19 5 S 6 VV 4301351193 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC FEE 15-11D-56 11 5 S 6 VV 4301351197 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC TTilBAL13H-10-56 11 5 S 6 VV 4301351209 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTRIBAL2-31D-45 31 4 S 5 VV 4301351261 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTRIBAL13H-24-45 24 4 S 5 VV 4301351273 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTETRIBAL6-21D-55 21 5 S 5 VV 4301351274 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTETTRIELAL15-16D-55 16 5 S 5 VV 4301351284 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAI.4H-15-55 15 5 S 5 VV 4301351292 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAI.13H-14-54 14 5 S 4 VV 4301351297 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAI.1-32-55 32 5 S 5 VV 4301351298 OilVVell Location Abandoned
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

UTE TRIBAL 4-2'ID-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301351299 OilWell Location Abandoned
c TRTBAL 12-3345 33 4 S 5 W 430't351301 OilWell Location Abandoned

UTE TRIBAL 16-15D.55 15 5 S 5 W 430't351302 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 2-24.55 24 5 S 5 W 4301351304 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 11.32D-56 32 5 S 6 W 4301 351 31 5 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 1-32D-56 32 5 S 6 W 4301351317 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 5H.32-56 32 5 S o W 4301 351 31 8 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRTBAL 14-28-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301 351 339 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 16-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301 351 340 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 3-31-45 31 4 S 5 W 43013s1347 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 1.18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 430't351367 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 9.18D.56 18 5 S 6 W 4301351368 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC FEE 9.23D.56 23 5 S 6 W 4301 351 380 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 1-34D-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301351382 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 12-21D-56 21 5 S b W 430135'1383 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 7-29D-56 29 5 S 6 W 4301351386 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 6.15-55 15 5 S 5 W 430135't399 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL7.2'IO-55 2',| 5 S 5 W 4301351403 OilWell Location Abandoned
cc FEE 13-9D-37 9 3 S 7 W 4301351409 OilWell Location Abandoned
cc FEE 16-21D-38 2',| 3 S I W 4301351410 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 5H-10-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301351415 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC FEE 14-1-56 1 5 S 6 W 4301351457 OilWell lqgqlimAbandoned

Location AbandonedLC TRIBAL 5-3D-56 3 5 S 6 W 4301351459 OilWell
LC TRIBAL 'I2H-23.56 23 5 S 6 W 4301351488 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 12HH-31-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301351499 OilWell Location Abandoned
CC Tribal 3-27D-38 27 3 S I W 4301351604 OilWell Location Abandoned
Mvrin Fee 3-16D-55 16 5 S 5 W 4301351633 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 12H.34-56 34 5 S 6 W 4301351634 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 12-16D-55 16 5 S 5 W 4301351635 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 13-1 1D-58 11 5 S 8 W 4301351708 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 15-1 1D-58 11 5 S 8 W 4301351709 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC FEE 1-11D-56 11 5 S 6 W 43013517',t2 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TribalSM-23-45 23 4 S 5 W 430135',t722 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal3-14D-58 11 5 S 8 W 4301351726 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 11-11D-58 '11 5 S 8 W 430'.t351729 OilWell Location Abandoned
GALLOWAY #3-128.2 12 2 S 2 W 4301351742 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 8-31D-56 31 5 S 6 W 4301351746 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Fee 2-6D-57 6 5 S 7 W 430135',t749 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 15-12D-58 12 5 S 8 W 4301 351 783 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal9-12D-58 12 5 S I W 4301351784 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 1-13D-58 12 5 S 8 W 4301 351 785 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 13-7D-57 12 5 S I W 4301351786 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal9-2D-58 ) 5 S 8 W 4301351788 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 1-2D-58 2 5 S 8 W 4301 351 789 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 5-1D-58 2 5 S I W 4301351790 OilWell Location Abandoned

6t14t2017

VVellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective:3/1/2017
UTETTRIELAL4-21D-55 21 5 S 5 VV 4301351299 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC TRIBAL12-33-45 33 4 S 5 W 4301351301 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAL16-15D-55 15 5 S 5 VV 4301351302 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LfflETRIEU\L2-24-55 2.4 5 S 5 VV 4301351304 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTilEL4L 11-32D-56 32 5 S 6 VV 4301351315 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTilELAL1-32D-56 32 5 S 6 VV 4301351317 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIELAL5H-32-56 32 5 S 6 VV 4301351318 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIELAL14-28-45 28 4 S 5 VV 4301351339 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL16-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301351340 OilWell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIELAL3-31-45 31 4 S 5 VV 4301351347 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTilELAL1-18D-56 18 5 S 6 VV 4301351367 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTRIBAJ.9-18D-56 18 5 S 6 VV 4301351368 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC FEE9-:23D-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301351380 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIELAL1-34D-45 34 4 S 5 VV 4301351382 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC:1TRIELAL12-21D-56 21 5 S 6 VV 4301351383 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIELAL7-29D-56 29 5 S 6 VV 4301351386 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAJ.6-15-55 15 5 S 5 VV 4301351399 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTETRIBA1.7-21D-55 21 5 S 5 VV 4301351403 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
CC FEE 13-9D-37 9 3 S 7 VV 4301351409 OilVVell Location Abandoned
CC FEE 16-:21D-38 21 3 S 8 VV 4301351410 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAI.5H-10-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301351415 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC FEE 14-1-56 1 5 S 6 VV 4301351457 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTTRIBAL5-3D-56 3 5 S 6 VV 4301351459 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC:1TRIELAL12H-23-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301351488 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAI.12HH-31-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301351499 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
CC Tribal3-27D-38 27 3 S 8 VV 4301351604 OilVVell Location Abandoned
MyrinFee3-16D-55 16 5 S 5 VV 4301351633 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTTRIELAL12H-34-56 34 5 S 6 VV 4301351634 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 12-16D-55 16 5 S 5 VV 4301351635 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTribal13-11D-58 11 5 S 8 VV 4301351708 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTribal15-11D-58 11 5 S 8 VV 4301351709 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC FEE 1-110-56 11 5 S 6 VV 4301351712 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal8M-23-·45 23 4 S 5 VV 4301351722 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTribal3-14D-58 11 5 S 8 VV 4301351726 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal11-11D-58 11 5 S 8 VV 4301351729 OilVVell Location Abandoned
GALLOVVAY#3-12B2 12 2 S 2 VV 4301351742 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIBAL8-31D-56 31 5 S 6 VV 4301351746 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCFee2-6D-57 6 5 S 7 \N 4301351749 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal15-12D-58 12 5 S 8 \N 4301351783 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal9-12D-58 12 5 S 8 VV 4301351784 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTribal1-13D-58 12 5 S 8 VV 4301351785 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC Tribal13-7D-57 12 5 S 8 VV 4301351786 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal9-2D-58 2 5 S 8 VV 4301351788 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal1-2D-58 2 5 S 8 VV 4301351789 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC Tribal5-1D-58 2 5 S 8 VV 4301351790 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
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VVellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective:3/1/2017
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UTETRIBAI.5H-10-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301351415 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC FEE 14-1-56 1 5 S 6 VV 4301351457 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTTRIBAL5-3D-56 3 5 S 6 VV 4301351459 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC:1TRIELAL12H-23-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301351488 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAI.12HH-31-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301351499 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
CC Tribal3-27D-38 27 3 S 8 VV 4301351604 OilVVell Location Abandoned
MyrinFee3-16D-55 16 5 S 5 VV 4301351633 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTTRIELAL12H-34-56 34 5 S 6 VV 4301351634 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 12-16D-55 16 5 S 5 VV 4301351635 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTribal13-11D-58 11 5 S 8 VV 4301351708 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTribal15-11D-58 11 5 S 8 VV 4301351709 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC FEE 1-110-56 11 5 S 6 VV 4301351712 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal8M-23-·45 23 4 S 5 VV 4301351722 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTribal3-14D-58 11 5 S 8 VV 4301351726 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal11-11D-58 11 5 S 8 VV 4301351729 OilVVell Location Abandoned
GALLOVVAY#3-12B2 12 2 S 2 VV 4301351742 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTTRIBAL8-31D-56 31 5 S 6 VV 4301351746 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCFee2-6D-57 6 5 S 7 \N 4301351749 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal15-12D-58 12 5 S 8 \N 4301351783 OilVVell Location Abandoned
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LC Tribal13-7D-57 12 5 S 8 VV 4301351786 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal9-2D-58 2 5 S 8 VV 4301351788 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal1-2D-58 2 5 S 8 VV 4301351789 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC Tribal5-1D-58 2 5 S 8 VV 4301351790 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

LC Fee 15-6D-57 6 5 S 7 W 4301351816 OilWell Location Abandoned
GALLOWAY 4-1482 14 2 S 2 W 4301351818 OilWell Location Abandoned
MORRIS #3-8B1 8 2 S 1 W 4301351836 OilWell Location Abandoned
FRrrz #3-24A2 24 1 S 2 W 430135'1837 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Fee 7-31D-45 31 4 S 5 W 430't351857 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TribalS-31D-45 31 4 S 5 W 4301351858 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 16-31-45 31 4 S 5 W 4301351863 OilWell Location Abandoned
_c FEE 4-32D-45 3'l 4 S 5 W 4301351892 OilWell Location Abandoned
lC Fee 8R-9-37 o 3 S 7 W 4301351937 OilWell Location Abandoned

-C Tribal 13-26D-56 26 5 S o W 4301352099 OilWell Location Abandoned
-C Tribal2-27D45 27 4 S 5 W 4301352100 OilWell Location Abandoned

-C Tribal 8-27D45 27 4 S 5 W 4301352'101 OilWell Location Abandoned
\bbott Fee 1-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352324 OilWell Location Abandoned
\bbott Fee 7-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352327 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 10.9D-54 I 5 S 4 W 4301352475 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 12-9D.54 9 5 S 4 W 430',t352476 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 16-9D-54 I 5 s 4 W 4301352478 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 11-9D-54 I 5 S 4 W 4301352544 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 6-5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352556 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 5.5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352557 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 4-5D.55 5 5 D 5 W 4301352558 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 3-5D-55 5 5 D 5 W 4301352559 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 1O-30D.55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352736 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 8.5D-55 5 5 S 5 W 4301352773 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 1-13D.55 13 5 S 5 W 4301352838 OilWell Location Abandoned
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-31 26 '12 S 7 E 4300730987 Drv Hole Plusged & Abandoned
SCOFIELD.THORPE 2643 26 12 S 7 E 4300730990 Drv Hole Plusqed & Abandoned
SCOFIELD CHRISTIANSEN 8-23 8 12 S 7 E 4300730999 Dry Hole Plugqed & Abandoned
MAUREL TAYLOR FEE 1.36M 36 1 S 2 W 4301330143 5525 OilWell Pluooed & Abandoned
NUTTERS RIDGE FED 5.1 5 6 S 4 W 4301330403 8231 OilWell rd & Abandoned
ANTELOPE RIDGE 24-1 24 6 S 5 W 4301330426 Drv Hole rd & Abandoned
B C UTE TRIBAL 8-21 21 5 S 4 W 4301330829 8414 Water lniection Well rd & Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 16-2146 21 4 S o W 430't333575 Dry Hole rd & Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 8-4-56 4 5 S o W 4301 333605 17046 OilWell Plugged & Abandoned
FOY 9-33D-55 33 5 S 5 W 4301333802 Dry Hole Plugged & Abandoned
EMERALD 2.3241 32 1 S I W 4301350059 Dry Hole Plugged & Abandoned
cc FEE 7-28-38 28 3 S I W 4301350887 Dry Hole Pluqqed & Abandoned
cc FEE 8-9-37 I 3 S 7 W 4301350896 Dry Hole Plugged & Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 5HH-5.56 4 5 S o W 4301350927 Drv Hole Plugged & Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 3.4D.56 4 5 S 6 W 4301 351 000 Dry Hole Plugged & Abandoned
GALLOWAY #3:148.2 14 2 S 2 W 430135',t741 Dry Hole Plugged & Abandoned
ST LOST CREEK 32-44 32 11 S 7 E 4304930023 Drv Hole Pluqoed & Abandoned
CLYDE MURRAY 1-242 2 1 S 2 W 4301330005 5876 OilWell Producino
VICTOR C BROWN 1-4M 4 1 S 2 W 430133001 1 5780 OilWell Producing

BOREN U 3-15A2 15 1 D 2 W 4301330086 5755 OilWell Prodrrcino

10 6t14t2017

VellTransfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

Ëffective:3/1/2017
LC Fee 15-6D-57 6 5 S 7 VV 4301351816 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
GÀLLOVVAY4-14B2 14 2 S 2 VV 4301351818 OilVVell Location Abandoned
MORRIS #3-8B1 8 2 S 1 VV 4301351836 OilVVell Location Abandoned
FRITZ#3-2.4A2 24 1 S 2 VV 4301351837 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LC:Fee7-31D-45 31 4 S 5 VV 4301351857 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC;Tribal5-31D-45 31 4 S 5 VV 4301351858 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LCTribal16-31-45 31 4 S 5 VV 4301351863 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC:FEE4-32D-45 31 4 S 5 VV 4301351892 OilVVell Location Abandoned
CC Fee8R-9-37 9 3 S 7 VV 4301351937 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal13-:26D-56 26 5 S 6 VV 4301352099 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal2-27D-45 27 .4 S 5 VV 4301352100 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal8-27D-45 27 4 S 5 VV 4301352101 OilVVell Location Abandoned
ÃlÃÑ>uFee 1-6D-54 6 5 S 4 VV 4301352324 OilVVell Location Abandoned
AbboñFee7-6D-54 6 5 S 4 VV 4301352327 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LÏTÍËFEE 10-9D-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301352475 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LTFEFEE 12-9D-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301352476 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 16-9D-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301352478 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTE FEE 11-9D-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301352544 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTETTilBAL6-5D-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301352556 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
UTE TTRIELAL5-50-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301352557 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETTRIBAL4-50-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301352558 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LTFETTRIELAL3-5D-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301352559 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAL 10-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352736 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LffETTRIELAL8-50-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301352773 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LTËEFEE 1-13D-55 13 5 S 5 VV 4301352838 OilVVell Location Abandoned
SÕOFIELD-THORPE 26-31 26 12 S 7 E 4300730987 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-43 26 12 S 7 E 4300730990 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
SCOFIELD CHRISTIANSEN 8-23 8 12 S 7 E 4300730999 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
\nAURELTAYLORFEE 1-36A2 36 1 S 2 VV 4301330143 5525 Oilm/ell Plu ed8:Abandoned99
NUTTERS RIDGE FED 5-1 5 6 S 4 W 4301330403 8231 OilWell Plugged &Abandoned
ANTELOPE RIDGE 24-1 24 6 S 5 W 4301330426 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
BC UTE TRIBAL 8-21 21 5 S 4 W 4301330829 8414 Water Injection Well Plugged &Abandoned
LC TRIBAL16-21-46 21 4 S 6 W 4301333575 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
LCTTilBAL8-4-56 4 5 S 6 VV 4301333605 17046 OilVVell Plugged&Abandoned
ÑiY9-33D-55 33 5 S 5 VV 4301333802 DyHole Plugged&Abandoned
EMERALD2-32A1 32 1 S 1 VV 4301350059 DryHole Plugged&Abandoned
CC_FEE7-28-38 28 3 S 8 VV 4301350887 DyHole Plugged&Abandoned
CC FEE 8-9-37 9 3 S 7 W 4301350896 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
LC TRIBAL5HH-5-56 4 5 S 6 W 4301350927 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
LCTRIBAL3-4D-56 4 5 S 6 VV 4301351000 D Hole Plu ed&Abandonedry gg
GALLOWAY#3-14B2 _ 14 2 S 2 W 4301351741 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
ST LOST CREEK 32-44 32 11 S 7 E 4304930023 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
CLYDEAMJRRAY1-2A2 2 1 S 2 VV |4301330005 5876 Oil\¾ell Producing
VICTORC BROVVN1-4A2 4 1 S 2 VV 4301330011 5780 OilVVell Producing
L BOREN U 3-15A2 15 1 S 2 W 4301330086 5755 OilWell Producing
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VellTransfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC
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UTETRIBAL 10-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352736 OilVVell LocationAbandoned
LffETTRIELAL8-50-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301352773 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LTËEFEE 1-13D-55 13 5 S 5 VV 4301352838 OilVVell Location Abandoned
SÕOFIELD-THORPE 26-31 26 12 S 7 E 4300730987 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-43 26 12 S 7 E 4300730990 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
SCOFIELD CHRISTIANSEN 8-23 8 12 S 7 E 4300730999 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
\nAURELTAYLORFEE 1-36A2 36 1 S 2 VV 4301330143 5525 Oilm/ell Plu ed8:Abandoned99
NUTTERS RIDGE FED 5-1 5 6 S 4 W 4301330403 8231 OilWell Plugged &Abandoned
ANTELOPE RIDGE 24-1 24 6 S 5 W 4301330426 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
BC UTE TRIBAL 8-21 21 5 S 4 W 4301330829 8414 Water Injection Well Plugged &Abandoned
LC TRIBAL16-21-46 21 4 S 6 W 4301333575 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
LCTTilBAL8-4-56 4 5 S 6 VV 4301333605 17046 OilVVell Plugged&Abandoned
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CC_FEE7-28-38 28 3 S 8 VV 4301350887 DyHole Plugged&Abandoned
CC FEE 8-9-37 9 3 S 7 W 4301350896 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
LC TRIBAL5HH-5-56 4 5 S 6 W 4301350927 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
LCTRIBAL3-4D-56 4 5 S 6 VV 4301351000 D Hole Plu ed&Abandonedry gg
GALLOWAY#3-14B2 _ 14 2 S 2 W 4301351741 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
ST LOST CREEK 32-44 32 11 S 7 E 4304930023 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
CLYDEAMJRRAY1-2A2 2 1 S 2 VV |4301330005 5876 Oil\¾ell Producing
VICTORC BROVVN1-4A2 4 1 S 2 VV 4301330011 5780 OilVVell Producing
L BOREN U 3-15A2 15 1 S 2 W 4301330086 5755 OilWell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
Effective:
LAMICQ.URTY U 3-'I7M 17 1 S 2 W 4301 330099 5745 OilWell Producinq

BOREN U 4-23M 23 1 S 2 W 43013301 15 5905 OilWell Producinq
TOMLINSON FED 1-25M 25 1 S 2 W 4301330120 5535 OilWell Producinq
WOODWARD'I-21A2 21 1 S 2 W 4301 3301 30 5665 OilWell Producinq
LAMICQ 1-2OM 20 1 S 2 W 4301 3301 33 5400 Gas Well Producinq

RBRTSN ST 1.182 1 2 S 2 W 4301330200 5410 OilWell Producing
SMITH ALBERT 1.8C5 8 3 S 5 W 4301330245 5490 OilWell Producinq
FRESTON ST,I-8B1 8 2 S 1 W 4301330294 5345 OilWell Producinq
GEORGE MURRAY 1.1681 16 2 S 1 W 4301330297 5950 OilWell Producinq
LAMICQ.URTY U 4-542 5 1 S 2 W 4301330347 5845 OilWell Producino
H G COLTHARP 1-15B1 15 2 S ,| W 4301330359 5945 OilWell Producino
STATE 3-18A1 18 1 S 1 W 4301330369 581 0 OilWell
BC UTE TRIBAL 4.22 22 5 S 4 W 4301330755 2620 OilWell
DILLMAN 2.28M 28 1 S 2 W 4301330821 5666 OilWell
B C UTE TRIBAL 16.16 16 5 S 4 W 4301330841 9489 OilWell
B C UTE TRIBAL ,14.15 15 5 S 4 W 4301330842 9440 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 1-32R 32 5 S 4 W 4301330872 1 3020 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 23-3R 23 5 S 4 W 4301330886 13034 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 13-3R-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301330924 9488 OilWell
S COTTONWOOD RIDGE UTE TRIBAL 1-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301 330933 9845 OilWell
TABBY CYN UTE TRIBAL 1-25 25 5 s 5 W 4301330945 9722 OilWell Producinq
S BRUNDAGE UTE TRIBAL 1-30 30 5 S 4 W 4301330948 9850 OilWell Producing
SOWERS CYN UTE TRIBAL 3-26 26 5 S 5 W 4301 330955 '10423 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 3.24R-55 (REENTRY) 24 5 D 5 W 4301330960 15173 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 1-20 20 5 S 4 W 4301330966 9925 OilWell Producinq
JOHN 2-3-82 3 2 S 2 W 4301330975 5387 OilWell Producino
TAMICQ-ROBERTSON ST 2.1 82 1 2 S 2 W 430133099s 5412 OilWell Producino
T C UTE TRIBAL 9.23X 23 5 S 5 W 4301 330999 9720 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2.742 7 1 S 2 W 4301 331 009 5836 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15.24R 24 5 S 5 W 4301331 129 11985 OilWell Producing
S BRUNDAGE CYN UTE TRIBAL 4.27 27 5 S 4 W 4301331 131 9851 OilWell Producing
HATCH 2-381 3 2 S ,l W 4301331147 10615 OilWell Producinq
NORLING 2-9B1 9 ) S 1 W 4301331 't51 10616 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 5-,I3 13 5 S 5 W 4301331 152 10421 OilWell Producinq
SHAW 2-27M 27 1 S 2 W 4301331 184 10753 OilWell Producing
LAMICQ-URRITY 4-1742 17 1 S 2 W 4301 331 1 90 10764 OilWell Producing
FRESTON 2-881 8 2 S ,l W 4301 331 203 108s1 OilWell Producinq
WISSE 3-3542 35 1 S 2 W 4301 33121 5 10925 OilWell Producing
MECCA 2-8A2 I 1 S 2 W 430133',t231 1 0981 OilWell Producing
SWYKES 2-21M 21 I S 2 W 4301 331 235 1 0998 OilWell Producing
SHERMAN 2.1282 12 2 S 2 W 4301331238 1 1009 OilWell Producing
DUNCAN 4-2A2 2 1 S 2 W 4301331276 11258 Gas Well Producing
HAMBLIN 3-942 I 1 S 2 W 4301331278 1 1094 Gas Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-20R.54 20 5 S 4 W 430't33't281 14088 OilWell Producino
ZandT UTE TRIBAL 7-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301331282 1',|131 OilWell Producinq

11 6t14t2017

ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.

fo: Linn Operation, LLC
Ëffective: 3/1/2017
LAMICQ-URTY U 3-17A2 17 1 S 2 W 4301330099 5745 OilWell Producing
L BOREN U 4-23A2 23 1 S 2 W 4301330115 5905 OilWell Producing
TOMLINSON FED 1-25A2 25 1 S 2 W 4301330120 5535 OilWell Producing
WOODWARD 1-21A2 21 1 S 2 W 4301330130 5665 OilWell Producing
LAþAICQ1-20A2 20 1 S 2 VV 4301330133 5400 GasVVell Producing
L RBRTSN ST 1-1B2 1 2 S 2 W 4301330200 5410 OilWell Producing
SMITH ALBERT 1-8C5 8 3 S 5 VV 4301330245 5490 Oil½/ell Producingi
FRESTCINST1-8B1 8 2 S 1 VV 4301330294 5345 Oil\Nell Producing
GEORGIEMURRAY1-16B1 16 2 S 1 W 4301330297 5950 OilWell Producing
LAMICQ-URTYU4-5A2 5 1 S 2 VV 4301330347 5845 OilVVell Producing
HG COLTHARP 1-15B1 15 2 S 1 W 4301330359 5945 OilWell Producing
STATE 3-18A1 18 1 S 1 VV 4301330369 5810 OilWell Producing
BC UTE TRIBAL 4-22 22 5 S 4 W 4301330755 2620 OilWell Producing
3ILLMAN2-2BA2 28 1 S 2 VV 4301330821 5666 OilVVell Pngducingi
BC UTE TRIBAL16-16 16 5 S 4 W 4301330841 9489 OilWell Producing
BC UTE TRIBAL14-15 15 5 S 4 W 4301330842 9440 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL1-32R 32 5 S 4 W 4301330872 13020 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL23-3R 23 5 S 4 W 4301330886 13034 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-3R-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301330924 9488 OilWell Producing
S COTTONWOOD RIDGE UTE TRIBAL 1-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301330933 9845 OilWell Producing
TABBY CYN UTE TRIBAL1-25 25 5 S 5 W 4301330945 9722 OilWell Producing
S BRUNDAGE UTE TRIBAL 1-30 30 5 S 4 W 4301330948 9850 OilWell Producing
SOWERS CYN UTE TRIBAL 3-26 26 5 S 5 W 4301330955 10423 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-24R-55 (REENTRY) 24 5 S 5 W 4301330960 15173 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 1-20 20 5 S 4 VV 4301330966 9925 OilVVell Producing
JOHN 2-3-B2 3 2 S 2 W 4301330975 5387 OilWell Producing
LAMICQ-ROBERTSON ST 2-182 1 2 S 2 W 4301330995 5412 OilWell Producing
TC UTE TRIBAL 9-23X 23 5 S 5 W 4301330999 9720 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-7A2 7 1 S 2 W 4301331009 5836 OilWell roducing
UTE TRIBAL 15-24R 24 5 S S W 4301331129 11985 OilWell Producing
S BRUNDAGE CYN UTE TRIBAL 4-27 27 5 S 4 W 4301331131 9851 OilWell Producing
FLATC‡d2-3B1 3 2 S 1 VV 4301331147 10615 OilVVell Producing
NORLING2-9B1 9 2 S 1 VV 4301331151 10616 Oil\Nell F4cducing
UTETRIBAL5-13 13 5 S 5 VV 4301331152 10421 Oil\Nell FNoducing
SHAVV2-27A2 27 1 S 2 VV 4301331184 10753 OilVVell P'roducing
LAMICQ-URRITY4-17A2 17 1 S 2 W 4301331190 10764 OilWell Producing
FRESTON 2-881 8 2 S 1 W 4301331203 10851 OilWell Producing
\NISSE3-35A2 35 1 S 2 VV 4301331215 10925 Oil\¾ell F4oducing

1ECCA2-8A2 8 1 S 2 VV 4301331231 10981 OilVVell Produciry
SWYKES 2-21A2 21 1 S 2 W 4301331235 10998 OilWell Produci
SHERAÆ4N2-12B2 12 2 S 2 VV 4301331238 11009 OilVVell fygdBREEL
DUNCAN 4-2A2 2 1 S 2 W 4301331276 11258 Gas Well Producing
HAMBLIN 3-9A2 9 1 S 2 W 4301331278 11094 Gas Well Producing
UTETRIBAL7-20R-54 20 5 S 4 VV 4301331281 14088 Oil\Nell Producing
ZandTUTETRIBAL7-19 19 5 S 4 VV 4301331282 11131 OilVVell Produciry
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

UTE TRIBAL 13-19 19 5 S 4 W 430'.133',1284 11134 OilWell Producing
BAR-F 2.581 5 2 S 1 W 4301 331 286 11',t',t3 OilWell Producing
ZandT UTE TRIBAL 7-25 25 5 D 5 W 4301 331 31 0 11416 OilWetl Producing
SMITH 2.9C5 o 3 S 5 W 4301 331 321 11245 OilWell Producinq
LORANGER 2-24M 24 1 S 2 W 430',t331322 11244 OilWell Producing
UTE 2.683 o 2 S 3 W 430133'1325 11446 OilWell Producinq
MCELPRANG 2.30A1 30 1 S 1 W 4301 331 326 1',t252 OilWell Producinq
SMITH 2.7C5 7 3 S 5 W 430133',t327 11324 OilWell Producinq
sMtrH 2-18C5 18 3 S 5 W 4301 331 328 1 1336 OilWell Producing
UTE2-2443 24 1 S 3 W 4301331329 1 1339 OilWell Producing
UTE 5-19A2 19 1 S 2 W 4301 331 330 1',t277 OilWell Producinq
EDWARDS 3-1081 10 2 S ,l W 4301 331 332 't't264 OilWell Producing
SUNDANCE 4-15M 15 1 S 2 W 4301 331 333 't1269 OilWell Producinq
LORANGER 6-22M 22 1 S 2 W 4301 331 334 11335 OilWell Producing
cox 2-36A2 36 1 S 2 W 4301 331 335 11330 OilWell Producinq
SMITH 2-6C5 3 S 5 W 4301 331 338 11367 OilWell Producing
FRESTON 2-781 7 2 S 1 W 4301 331 341 1 1338 OilWell Producing
PEARSON 2-118.2 11 2 S 2 W 430'1331356 1 1359 OilWell Producing
LAMB 2-16A2 16 1 S 2 W 4301 331 390 11487 OilWell Producino
LABRUM 2-23M 23 I S 2 W 4301 331 393 '11514 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-17 17 5 S 4 W 4301 331 546 11921 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301 331 547 't1920 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 13-22 22 5 S 4 W 4301 331 548 't1926 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 1.28 28 5 S 4 W 4301 331 549 '11925 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 4-30 30 5 S 4 W 4301 331 550 11g',t4 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-16 16 5 S 4 W 4301 331 648 1 1951 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 16-18 18 5 S 4 W 4301 3316s0 1 1946 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5.20 20 5 S 4 W 4301 331 651 11957 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 15-23 23 5 S 5 W 4301 331671 1 1989 OilWell Producinq
TABBY CANYON 1.21 21 5 S 5 W 4301 331699 12225 OilWell Producinq
rABBY CANYON 8-22 22 5 S 5 W 4301 331 700 12008 OilWell Producinq
SOWERS CANYON 9-27 27 5 S 5 W 4301 331 701 11997 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 9-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301 331 831 12',175 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301 331 832 12180 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2.25 25 5 S 5 W 4301 331 833 12153 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3.25 25 5 S 5 W 4301 331 834 121s2 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 11-24 24 5 S 5 W 4301 331 909 12190 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 13.24 24 5 S 5 W 4301 331 91 0 12217 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 11-25 25 5 S 5 W 4301 331 91 1 12182 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1.26 26 5 S 5 W 4301 331 91 2 12235 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301332140 12795 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 6-25H 25 5 S 5 W 4301 332143 12750 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9.18 18 5 S 4 W 4301332144 12746 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 11.17 17 5 S 4 W 4301332145 12747 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-17 17 5 S 4 W 4301332146 12745 OilWell Producino

12 6t14t2017

Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL13-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301331284 11134 OilWell Producing
BAR-F2-5B1 5 2 S 1 VV 4301331286 11113 Oil\¾ell Producing
ZandTUTETRIBAL7-25 25 5 S 5 VV 4301331310 11416 OilVVell Producing
SMITH 2-9C5 9 3 S 5 W 4301331321 11245 OilWell Producing
LORANGER2-24A2 24 1 S 2 W 4301331322 11244 OilWell Producing
UTE2-6B3 6 2 S 3 VV 4301331325 11446 JiÏVVell P'roducing
NACELPPAJ‡G2-30A1 30 1 S 1 VV 4301331326 11252 Oil\Nell Producing
SMFDB2-7C5 7 3 S 5 VV 4301331327 11324 OilVVell Producing
SMFDB2-18C5 18 3 S 5 VV 4301331328 11336 OilVVell Pyoduciry
UTE2-24A3 24 1 S 3 VV 4301331329 11339 OilVVell Produciry
UTE 5-19A2 19 1 S 2 VV 4301331330 11277 OilVVell Producing
EDWARDS 3-10B1 10 2 S 1 W 4301331332 11264 OilWell Producing
SUNDANCE 4-15A2 15 1 S 2 W 4301331333 11269 OilWell Producing
LORANGER6-22A2 22 1 S 2 W 4301331334 11335 OilWell Producing
COX2-36A2 36 1 S 2 VV 4301331335 11330 OilVVell Produciry)
S TH2-6C5 6 3 S 5 VV 4301331338 11367 OilVVell Producingi
FRESTON2-7B1 7 2 S 1 VV 4301331341 11338 OilVVell P'roducing
PEARSON 2-11B2 11 2 S 2 W 4301331356 11359 OilWell Producing
LAAAB2-16A2 16 1 S 2 VV 4301331390 11487 OilVVell Producirg;
LABRUM2-23A2 23 1 S 2 W 4301331393 11514 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-17 17 5 S 4 W 4301331546 11921 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301331547 11920 OilWell Prod
UTETRIBAL 13-22 22 5 S 4 VV 4301331548 11926 OilVVell Producin9
UTETRIBAL1-28 28 5 S 4 VV 4301331549 11925 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-30 30 5 S 4 W 4301331550 11914 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-16 16 5 S 4 W 4301331648 11951

_

OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAA.16-18 18 5 S -4 VV 4301331650 11946 OilVVell P'roducingi
UTETRIBAL5-20 20 5 S 4 VV 4301331651 11957 Clil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAL15-23 23 5 S 5 VV 4301331671 11989 Oil\¾ell Producing
TABBY CANYON1-21 21 5 S 5 W 4301331699 12225 OilWell Producin9
TABBYCANYON8-22 22 5 S 5 W 4301331700 12008 OilWell Producing
SOWERS CANYON 9-27 27 5 S 5 W 4301331701 11997 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301331831 12175 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBA1.15-19 19 5 S 4 VV 4301331832 12180 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL2-25 25 5 S 5 VV 4301331833 12153 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAL3-25 25 5 S 5 VV 4301331834 12152 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAL11-24 24 5 S 5 VV 4301331909 12190 OilViell Producin
UTETRIBAI.13-24 24 5 S 5 VV 4301331910 12217 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL11-25 25 5 S 5 VV 4301331911 12182 Oilmfell Producing
UTETRIBA1.1-26 26 5 S 5 VV 4301331912 12235 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL2-19 19 5 S 4 VV 4301332140 12795 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBA1.6-25H 25 5 S 5 VV 4301332143 12750 OilVVell Prodtp:ing
UTE TRIBAL9-18 18 5 S 4 W 4301332144 12746 OilWell Producin
UTETRIBAL11-17 17 5 S 4 VV 4301332145 12747 Oil\¾ell Producin 9UTETRIBAA.12-17 17 5 S 4 VV 4301332146 12745 OilVVell P'roducirK
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

UTE TRIBAL 15.18 18 5 S 4 W 4301332148 12794 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6.22 22 5 S 4 W 4301332163 12974 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 6-21 21 5 D 4 W 4301332164 12994 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 7-28 28 5 S 4 W 4301332166 12995 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 11-20 20 5 S 4 W 4301332168 12946 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 13-25 25 5 S 5 W 4301 332169 't2857 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2-27 27 5 S 4 W 4301332179 't297s OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 1-34 34 5 S 4 W 4301 3321 86 13',t21 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-35 35 5 S 5 W 4301332',t87 13021 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 4-36 36 5 S 5 W 4301 3321 88 1 3063 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 5-28 28 5 S 4 W 4301 3321 89 13026 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 5-3.I 31 5 S 4 W 4301 3321 90 13080 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 9-26 26 5 S 4 W 4301332191 13'101 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL ,I1.28 28 5 S 4 W 4301332192 13022 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 3.29 29 5 S 4 W 4301332193 13042 OilWell Producino
BOWMAN 5-542 5 1 S 2 W 4301332202 13043 OilWell Producing
BOREN 4-9A2 9 1 S 2 W 4301332203 13079 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301332204 13090 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-15 15 5 S 4 W 4301332205 13100 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 13-20 20 5 s 4 W 4301332206 13048 OilWell Producing
BLANCHARD 3.10A2 10 1 S 2 W 4301332223 '13149 OilWell Producing
SQUIRES 3-8A2 8 ,| S 2 ry

W
430',t332227 13176 OilWell Producinq

UTE TRIBAL 1-24-55 24 5 S 5 430'.t332259 13618 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 3.28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332261 13644 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 5-26.55 26 5 S 5 W 4301332264 '13642 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 6-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332265 13600 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 8-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301332267 13571 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 9-24-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301332268 13620 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 11-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332269 13572 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 15.25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332271 13566 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 16.14.55 14 5 S 5 W 4301332272 13567 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL'15-27.55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332339 14020 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 5-15.55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332344 13606 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-20-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301332346 13607 OilWell Producino
MOON TRTBAL 12-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 430',t332347 14008 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL '14-28.55 28 5 S 5 W 4301332348 13580 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301332349 13581 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-32.55 32 5 S 5 W 4301332350 13695 OilWell Producino
FOYTRIBAL 11.34-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301332351 13648 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-35.55 35 5 S 5 W 4301332352 14267 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301332353 13645 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332354 13643 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332355 14262 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 16.36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332356 14122 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-55 33 5 S 5 W 4301332357 1 3685 OilWell Producino
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ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC
ffective: 3/1/2017

UTETRIBAJ.15-18 18 5 S 4 VV 4301332148 12794 OilVVell P'roducirmi
UTE TRIBAL6-22 22 5 S 4 W 4301332163 12974 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAA.6-21 21 5 S 4 VV 4301332164 12994 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL7-:28 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332166 12995 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBA1.11-20 20 5 S 4 VV 4301332168 12946 OilVVell Producirgi
UTE TRIBAL13-25 25 5 S 5 W 4301332169 12857 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL2-27 27 5 S 4 VV 4301332179 12975 OilvVell Producing
UTETRIILAL 1-34 34 5 S 4 VV 4301332186 13121 OilvVell Producing
UTETRIBAI.2-35 35 5 S 5 VV 4301332187 13021 OilVVell Producirgi
UTE TRIBAL4-36 36 5 S 5 W 4301332188 13063 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL5-28 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332189 13026 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-31 31 5 S 4 W 4301332190 13080 OilWell Producing
UTETRIIL4L9-26 26 5 S 4 VV 4301332191 13101 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE TRIBAL11-28 28 5 S 4 W 4301332192 13022 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.3-29 29 5 S 4 VV 4301332193 13042 OilVVell Producirg;
BOVVMAN5-5A2 5 1 S 2 VV 4301332202 13043 OilVVell Producin9
BOREN 4-9A2 9 1 S 2 W 4301332203 13079 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301332204 13090 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-15 15 5 S 4 W 4301332205 13100 OilWell Pr
UTE TRIBAL 13-20 20 5 S 4 W 4301332206 13048 OilWell Producing
BLANCHARD3-10A2 10 1 S 2 W 4301332223 13149 OilWell Producing
SQUIRES 3-8A2 8 1 S 2 W 4301332227 13176 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 1-24-55 24 5 S 5 VV 4301332259 13618 OilViell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332261 13644 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-26-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301332264 13642 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332265 13600 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301332267 13571 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL9-24-55 24 5 S 5 VV 4301332268 13620 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL11-23-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301332269 13572 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332271 13566 _ OilWell Producin
UTETRIBAL16-14-55 14 5 S 5 VV 4301332272 13567 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332339 14020 OilWell Producing
LifE TRIBAL5-15-55 15 5 S 5 VV 4301332344 13606 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-20-55 20 5 S 5 |W 4301332346 13607 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL12-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332347 14008 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-28-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301332348 13580 OilWell Producing
UTETRIISAL16-29-55 29 5 S 5 VV 4301332349 13581 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-32-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301332350 13695 OilWell Producing
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UTETRIBAL16-35-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301332352 14267 OilVVell P·roducing
UTE TRIBAL10-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301332353 13645 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332354 13643 OilWell Producing
UTETTRIBAL14-36-55 36 5 S 5 VV 4301332355 14262 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL16-36-55 36 5 S 5 VV _4301332356 14122 OilViell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-55 33 5 S 5 W 4301332357 13685 OilWell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

JTE TRIBAL 15-17-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301 332358 13698 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 12.14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301332369 't3647 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 3-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 430'.t332377 't3955 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 4-21.54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332378 1 3907 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 9-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301 332379 13906 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 5-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301 332380 1 3905 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 9-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301 332383 140s0 OilWell Producing
JTE TRTBAL 12-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301 332385 13928 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 15.20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332386 1391 1 OilWell
JTE TRIBAL '13.28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332387 13908 OilWell Producing
,TE TRIBAL 9-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332388 13910 OilWell Producino
,TE TRIBAL 15.28.54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332389 1 3909 OilWell Producino
,TE TRIBAL 9.25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332390 137',t5 OilWell Producing
rlooN TRtBAL6-27-54 27 5 s 4 W 4301332407 13969 OilWell Producing
rlooN TRTBAL 14-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332408 1 3998 OilWell Producing
ITE TRIBAL 3-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332410 13949 OilWell Producing

.JTE TRIBAL 7.32-54 32 5 S 4 W 430133241',| 13936 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 7.33.54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332413 13945 OilWell Producing
IJTE TRIBAL 11-20.55 20 5 S 5 W 4301332415 14269 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 'I-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332416 13947 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 3.27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332417 't4022 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332418 13948

14580
OilWell Producinq

UTE TRIBAL 10.28.55 28 5 S 5 W 43013324',t9 OilWell Producinq
TRTBAL 6-32-55 32 5 S 5 W 430',t332420 14895 OilWell
TRTBAL 8-32-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301332421 14896 OilWell Producinq

JTE TRIBAL 2-36.55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332422 1 3937 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 8-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332423 14021 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 13.16-54 16 5 S 4 W 430133251 1 1 3981 OilWell Producinq

UTE TRIBAL 11.30.54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332512 13982 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332513 1 3975 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 7-23.55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332514 13976 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 430',t33252'.1 14060 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 430'.t332522 14061 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14.32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332523 14062 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1.23.55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332524 14044 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332525 't4045 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 1-31-54 31 5 s 4 W 4301332526 14116 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 3-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332527 14109 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 7-3'I-54 31 5 D 4 W 4301332s28 14160 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9.31.54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332529 14177 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 11-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332530 14163 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 3.23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332536 14077 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 5.23.55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332537 14108 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 9-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332538 14199 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 5-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332539 14112 OilWell Producino
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Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
Ëffective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL15-17-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301332358 13698 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301332369 13647 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332377 13955 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332378 13907 OilWell Producing
UTETRIIBAL9-20-fd 20 5 S 4 VV 4301332379 13906 OilvVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332380 13905 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332383 14050 OilWell Producing
UTETTRIBAL12-21-54 21 5 S 4 VV 4301332385 13928 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332386 13911 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332387 13908 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332388 13910 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 15-28-5.4 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332389 13909 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332390 13715 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL6-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332407 13969 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL14-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332408 13998 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332410 13949 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL7-32-54 32 5 S 4 VV 4301332411 13936 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332413 13945 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL11-20-55 20 5 S 5 VV 4301332415 14269 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETTRIELAL1-27-55 27 5 S 5 VV 4301332416 13947 OilVVell Producin 9
UTE TRIBAL 3-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332417 14022 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332418 13948 OilWell Producing
LifETTRIE14L10-28-55 28 5 S 5 VV 4301332419 14580 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL6i-32-55 32 5 S 5 VV 4301332420 14895 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-32-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301332421 14896 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332422 13937 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332423 14021 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301332511 13981 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-30-54 30 5 S 4 W_ 4301332512 13982 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332513 13975 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL7-23-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301332514 13976 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBALS-33-54 33 5 S 4 VV 4301332521 14060 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL11-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332522 14061 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332523 14062 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332524 14044 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332525 14045 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332526 14116 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL3-31-54 31 5 S 4 VV 4301332527 14109 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAI.7-31-54 31 5 S 4 VV 4301332528 14160 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332529 14177 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.11-31-54_ 31 5 S 4 VV 4301332530 14163 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332536 14077 OilWell Producin
UTETRIBAL5-23-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301332537 14108 OilvVell Producing
LJTETTRIELAL9-32-54 32 5 S 4 VV 4301332538 14199 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAJ.5-32-54 32 5 S 4 VV 4301332539 14112 OilVVell Producing

14

Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
Ëffective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL15-17-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301332358 13698 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301332369 13647 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332377 13955 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332378 13907 OilWell Producing
UTETRIIBAL9-20-fd 20 5 S 4 VV 4301332379 13906 OilvVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332380 13905 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332383 14050 OilWell Producing
UTETTRIBAL12-21-54 21 5 S 4 VV 4301332385 13928 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332386 13911 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332387 13908 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332388 13910 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 15-28-5.4 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332389 13909 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332390 13715 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL6-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332407 13969 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL14-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332408 13998 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332410 13949 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL7-32-54 32 5 S 4 VV 4301332411 13936 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332413 13945 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL11-20-55 20 5 S 5 VV 4301332415 14269 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETTRIELAL1-27-55 27 5 S 5 VV 4301332416 13947 OilVVell Producin 9
UTE TRIBAL 3-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332417 14022 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332418 13948 OilWell Producing
LifETTRIE14L10-28-55 28 5 S 5 VV 4301332419 14580 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL6i-32-55 32 5 S 5 VV 4301332420 14895 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-32-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301332421 14896 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332422 13937 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332423 14021 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301332511 13981 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-30-54 30 5 S 4 W_ 4301332512 13982 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332513 13975 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL7-23-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301332514 13976 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBALS-33-54 33 5 S 4 VV 4301332521 14060 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL11-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332522 14061 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332523 14062 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332524 14044 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332525 14045 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332526 14116 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL3-31-54 31 5 S 4 VV 4301332527 14109 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAI.7-31-54 31 5 S 4 VV 4301332528 14160 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332529 14177 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.11-31-54_ 31 5 S 4 VV 4301332530 14163 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301332536 14077 OilWell Producin
UTETRIBAL5-23-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301332537 14108 OilvVell Producing
LJTETTRIELAL9-32-54 32 5 S 4 VV 4301332538 14199 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAJ.5-32-54 32 5 S 4 VV 4301332539 14112 OilVVell Producing

14



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

1t20
TRTBAL 10-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301 332540 14195 OilWell Producino
TRTBAL 12-27-s4 27 5 S 4 W 4301332541 14161 OilWell Producino
TRTBAL 8-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301 332543 14139 OilWell Producino

UTE TRIBAL 9-33-54 33 5 D 4 W 4301 332549 14162 OilWell Producing
WILLIAMSON TRIBAL 3-34.54 34 5 S 4 W 4301 332550 14222 OilWell Producing
WILLIAMSON TRIBAL 5-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301 3325s1 't4235 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6.2.65 2 c S 5 W 4301332557 14655 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-29.54 29 5 S 4 W 4301 332561 14316 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 7-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301 332562 14354 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 1'I-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301 332563 14337 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 13-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301 332564 14315 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-29.54 29 5 S 4 W 4301 332565 '14367 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 1.35-54 35 5 D 4 W 4301 332567 14266 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11.13-54 13 5 S 4 W 4301 332568 14281 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-24.54 24 5 S 4 W 4301 332569 14314 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-18.54 18 5 s 4 W 4301332571 14388 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332572 14336 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-24.54 24 5 S 4 W 4301 332573 14247 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 6.14.54 '14 5 S 4 W 4301 332586 15270 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10.15.54 15 5 S 4 W 4301 332587 14',194 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 16-15.54 15 5 S 4 W 4301 332588 14311 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 11.16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301 332589 14178 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-22.54 22 5 S 4 W 4301 332590 '14219 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332591 14328 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 'IO-22.54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332592 14218 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301 332593 't4220 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 13-13.55 't3 5 S 5 W 4301 332599 't5134 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 13.14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301 332600 14236 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301 332602 14263 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1O-21-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301 332603 14385 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 2-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301 332604 14268 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 3.22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332605 14298 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301 332606 14330 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11.22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301 332607 't4329 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 3-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301 33261 3 14416 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-27.55 27 5 S 5 W 43013326't4 14881 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL '11-27.55 27 5 S 5 W 4301 33261 5 14882 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 12.22.55 22 5 S 5 W 4301 332616 14370 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-22.55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332617 14921 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332620 14365 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 4-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 430133262',1 '14518 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332622 14382 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 5.22.54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332624 14547 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3.30.54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332625 14364 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 3-10-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301332663 144',14 OilWell Producino

15 6t14t2017

'Nell Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
Iffective: 3/1/2017
MOON TRIBAL 10-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332540 14195 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL12-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332541 14161 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 8-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332543 14139 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332549 14162 Oil Well Producing
WILLIAMSON TRIBAL3-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301332550 14222 OilWell Producing
WILLIAMSONTRIBAL5-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301332551 14235 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6-2-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301332557 14655 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332561 14316 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332562 14354 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332563 14337 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332564 14315 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332565 14367 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332567 14266 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-54 13 5 S 4 W 4301332568 14281 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332569 14314 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301332571 14388 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332572 14336 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332573 14247 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301332586 15270 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332587 14194 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL16-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332588 14311 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301332589 14178 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332590 14219 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332591 14328 OilWell _ __ Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332592 14218 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332593 14220 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-13-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301332599 15134 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301332600 14236 OilWell Producing
ÜÌE TRIBAL 13-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332602 14263 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-21-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301332603 14385 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332604 14268 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332605 14298 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332606 14330 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332607 14329 Oil Well Producini
MOONTRIBAL 3-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332613 14416 OilWell Produc
UTE TRIBAL5-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332614 14881 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332615 14882 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332616 14370 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332617 14921 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332620 14365 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332621 14518 OilWell Producing
ÜŸE TRIBAL 6-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332622 14382 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 5-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332624 14547 OilWell Pr
UTE TRIBAL3-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332625 14364 OilWell Pr
UTE TRIBAL3-10-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301332663 14414 OilWell Producing

15

'Nell Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
Iffective: 3/1/2017
MOON TRIBAL 10-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332540 14195 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL12-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332541 14161 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 8-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332543 14139 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332549 14162 Oil Well Producing
WILLIAMSON TRIBAL3-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301332550 14222 OilWell Producing
WILLIAMSONTRIBAL5-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301332551 14235 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6-2-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301332557 14655 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332561 14316 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332562 14354 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332563 14337 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332564 14315 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332565 14367 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332567 14266 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-54 13 5 S 4 W 4301332568 14281 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332569 14314 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301332571 14388 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332572 14336 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332573 14247 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301332586 15270 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332587 14194 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL16-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332588 14311 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301332589 14178 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332590 14219 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332591 14328 OilWell _ __ Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332592 14218 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332593 14220 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-13-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301332599 15134 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301332600 14236 OilWell Producing
ÜÌE TRIBAL 13-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332602 14263 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-21-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301332603 14385 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332604 14268 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332605 14298 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332606 14330 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332607 14329 Oil Well Producini
MOONTRIBAL 3-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332613 14416 OilWell Produc
UTE TRIBAL5-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332614 14881 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-27-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301332615 14882 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332616 14370 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301332617 14921 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332620 14365 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332621 14518 OilWell Producing
ÜŸE TRIBAL 6-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332622 14382 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 5-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332624 14547 OilWell Pr
UTE TRIBAL3-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332625 14364 OilWell Pr
UTE TRIBAL3-10-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301332663 14414 OilWell Producing

15



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

UTE TRIBAL 15-32.54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332666 14460 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 8.31-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301332673 14407 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 3-35-54 35 5 s 4 W 430'.t332675 14656 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2.30-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301332680 14427 OilWell Producino
BROWN 3-4A2 4 1 S 2 W 4301332684 14673 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 9-'17-54 't7 5 s 4 W 4301332687 1 5309 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 13-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332688 14517 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 14-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332690 14546 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 16.19.54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332691 14491 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-32.54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332692 14490 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-'14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301332693 15136 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301332694 14574 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6.1.65 1 6 S 5 W 4301332699 '15776 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 430133270',1 14573 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14.20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332702 14459 OilWell Producing
#1 DLB 12-15-56 15 5 S 6 W 430',t3327',to 14943 Gas Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12J19-54 19 5 S 4 W 43013327'.t6 14627 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10.19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332717 14628 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332718 14604 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 11-12.55 't2 5 S 5 W 430',t332721 1460s OilWell Producinq
NIELSEN MARSING 1 3-14-56 14 5 S 6 W 430',t332737 15060 OilWell Producino
TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301332738 15058 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 16-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332739 14671 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 'IO-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332740 14691 OilWell Producinq

TRTBAL 4-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332741 14672 OilWell Producinq
TRTBAL 13-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332742 14736 OilWell Producinq
TRTBAL 15-31-54
TRTBAL 8-30-54

31 q
5

S 4 W 4301332743 14690 OilWell Producino
30 S 4 W 4301332746 1 5583 OilWell Producing

TRTBAL 10-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332749 14758 OilWell Producing
TRTBAL 14-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332750 '14798 OilWell Producino
TRTBAL 3-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 430',t33275',1 14842 OilWell Producing
TRTBAL 16-16-55 16 5 S 5 W 4301332757 14865 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 3-21.55 21 5 S 5 W 4301332758 '151',12 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16.25.55 25 5 S 5 W 430',t332759 't4821 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 1-36.55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332760 't4822 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 430',t332761 15661 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332762 14845 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2-28.54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332763 '14723 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 10-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 430',t332764 't4722 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL '12.28.54 28 5 S 4 W 430'.t332765 14701 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-28.54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332766 '14777 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 430',t332767 14494 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 15-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 430',t332768 15210 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 12-25-55 25 5 S 5 W. 4301332769 14799 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7.35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332774 15019 OilWell Pradrrcinn

16 6t14t2017

ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

Ë¾ective:3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL15-32-54 32 5 S 4 VV 4301332666 14460 OilVVell Producirš[
UTETRIBALS-31-55 31 5 S 5 VV 4301332673 14407 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBA1.3-35-5.4 35 5 S 4 VV 4301332675 14656 OilVVell Producirg¡
UTE TRIBAL 2-30-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301332680 14427 OilWell Producing
BROVVhl_3-‡A2 4 1 S 2 VV 4301332684 14673 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL.9-17-54 17 5 S 4 VV 4301332687 15309 OilVVell Producin 9
UTE TRIBAL 13-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332688 14517 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332690 14546 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332691 14491 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332692 14490 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301332693 15136 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301332694 14574 OilWell Producing
FEDERAd.6-1-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301332699 15776 Oil\Nell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL 9-15-55 15 5 S 5 VV 4301332701 14573 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAI.14-20-5.4 20 5 S 4 \N 4301332702 14459 OilVVell PToducirmi
#1 CRJB12-15-56 15 5 S 6 \A/ 4301332710 14943 GhasVVell Producing;
UTETRIBAI.12-19-54 09 5 S 4 VV 4301332716 14627 OilVVell PToducirmi
UTETRIBAI.10-19-54 09 5 S 4 VV 4301332717 14628 OilVVell PToducirmi
UTE TRIBAL16-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332718 14604 Oil Well Producing
LffE 11RIBAJ.11-12-55 12 5 S 5 VV 4301332721 14605 OilVVell Producinig
NIELSEN MARSING13-14-56 14 5 S 6 W 4301332737 15060 Oil Well Producing
TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301332738 15058 OilWell Producing
UTE TTilELAL16-20-54 20 5 S 4 VV 4301332739 14671 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAA.10-20-54 20 5 S 4 VV 4301332740 14691 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL4-28-54 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332741 14672 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332742 14736 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332743 14690 OilWell Producing
UTETTRIELAL8-30-54 30 5 S 4 VV 4301332746 15583 OilVVell Produciry
UTE TRIBAL 10-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332749 14758 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332750 14798 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL3-36-55 36 5 S 5 VV 4301332751 14842 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAI.16-16-55 16 5 S 5 VV 4301332757 14865 OilVVell P'roducirgi
UTETRIBAL3-21-55 21 5 S 5 VV 4301332758 15112 Oil\Nell Producing
LTTETTRIELAL16-25-55 25 5 S 5 VV 4301332759 14821 OilVVell Producirg;
UTETRIBAL1-36-55 36 5 S 5 VV 4301332760 14822 Oil\Nell Producing
ÜTE TRIBAL7-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332761 15661 OilWell Producin
LÏÏE TRIBAL 2-31-54 31 5 S 4 VV 4301332762 14845 OilVVell Produciry
UTETRIBAL2-28-54 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332763 14723 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332764 14722 OilWell Producing
UTETTilELAL12-28-54 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332765 14701 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL8-28-54 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332766 14777 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIELAL4-31-54 31 5 S 4 VV 4301332767 14494 OilVVell P·roducing
UTE TRIBAL15-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332768 15210 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-25-55 25 5 S 5 W . 4301332769 14799 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL7-35-54 35 5 S 4 VV 4301332774 15019 Oil\Nell Producing
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ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

Ë¾ective:3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL15-32-54 32 5 S 4 VV 4301332666 14460 OilVVell Producirš[
UTETRIBALS-31-55 31 5 S 5 VV 4301332673 14407 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBA1.3-35-5.4 35 5 S 4 VV 4301332675 14656 OilVVell Producirg¡
UTE TRIBAL 2-30-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301332680 14427 OilWell Producing
BROVVhl_3-‡A2 4 1 S 2 VV 4301332684 14673 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL.9-17-54 17 5 S 4 VV 4301332687 15309 OilVVell Producin 9
UTE TRIBAL 13-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332688 14517 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332690 14546 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332691 14491 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332692 14490 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301332693 15136 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301332694 14574 OilWell Producing
FEDERAd.6-1-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301332699 15776 Oil\Nell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL 9-15-55 15 5 S 5 VV 4301332701 14573 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAI.14-20-5.4 20 5 S 4 \N 4301332702 14459 OilVVell PToducirmi
#1 CRJB12-15-56 15 5 S 6 \A/ 4301332710 14943 GhasVVell Producing;
UTETRIBAI.12-19-54 09 5 S 4 VV 4301332716 14627 OilVVell PToducirmi
UTETRIBAI.10-19-54 09 5 S 4 VV 4301332717 14628 OilVVell PToducirmi
UTE TRIBAL16-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332718 14604 Oil Well Producing
LffE 11RIBAJ.11-12-55 12 5 S 5 VV 4301332721 14605 OilVVell Producinig
NIELSEN MARSING13-14-56 14 5 S 6 W 4301332737 15060 Oil Well Producing
TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301332738 15058 OilWell Producing
UTE TTilELAL16-20-54 20 5 S 4 VV 4301332739 14671 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAA.10-20-54 20 5 S 4 VV 4301332740 14691 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL4-28-54 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332741 14672 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332742 14736 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332743 14690 OilWell Producing
UTETTRIELAL8-30-54 30 5 S 4 VV 4301332746 15583 OilVVell Produciry
UTE TRIBAL 10-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332749 14758 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332750 14798 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL3-36-55 36 5 S 5 VV 4301332751 14842 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAI.16-16-55 16 5 S 5 VV 4301332757 14865 OilVVell P'roducirgi
UTETRIBAL3-21-55 21 5 S 5 VV 4301332758 15112 Oil\Nell Producing
LTTETTRIELAL16-25-55 25 5 S 5 VV 4301332759 14821 OilVVell Producirg;
UTETRIBAL1-36-55 36 5 S 5 VV 4301332760 14822 Oil\Nell Producing
ÜTE TRIBAL7-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332761 15661 OilWell Producin
LÏÏE TRIBAL 2-31-54 31 5 S 4 VV 4301332762 14845 OilVVell Produciry
UTETRIBAL2-28-54 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332763 14723 Oil\Nell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332764 14722 OilWell Producing
UTETTilELAL12-28-54 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332765 14701 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL8-28-54 28 5 S 4 VV 4301332766 14777 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIELAL4-31-54 31 5 S 4 VV 4301332767 14494 OilVVell P·roducing
UTE TRIBAL15-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332768 15210 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-25-55 25 5 S 5 W . 4301332769 14799 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL7-35-54 35 5 S 4 VV 4301332774 15019 Oil\Nell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

3t1
JTE TRIBAL 16-24.54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332775 '14762 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 14-25-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332776 14753 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 16-25.54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332779 1 5078 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8.25.54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332780 15280 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 9.35.54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332781 1 5535 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 6-30-55 30 5 S 5 W 430'.t332783 15163 OilWell Producinq
MOON TRIBAL 4-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332800 14985 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 5-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332802 14984 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332803 15151 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332804 15185 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 5.35-54 35 5 s 4 W 4301 332805 15485 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 13-35.54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332806 15292 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 11.35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332807 15317 OilWell Producino

UTE TRIBAL 8-19.54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332840 14946 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-20.55 20 5 S 5 W 430',t332841 1 5097 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 430',t332842 15015 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 6-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332843 151 13 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL '11.26-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301332844 1 5233 OilWell Producing
MOON TRTBAL'.15-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332846 151 15 OilWell Producino

UTE TRIBAL 1O-31.54 31 5 S 4 W 430',t332847 14956 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 6-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332848 16656 OilWell Producino
ST TRIBAL 2-15.54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332849 16959 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 4.15.54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332850 't7478 OilWell Producino
ST TRIBAL 8-15-54 '15 5 S 4 W 4301332851 16279 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332856 15430 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 3.30-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301332862 1 5340 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 7.19.55 19 5 S 5 W 4301332863 15279 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 8-19-55 19 5 D 5 W 4301 332864 15241 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 6-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301 332865 14947 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301 332866 14924 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301 332867 15554 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 2.26-54 26 5 S 4 W 430't332868 1523',1 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301 332869 14970 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 8.32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301 332870 15152 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332871 1 5040 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-33.54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332872 15059 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301 332889 1 5607 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-26.54 26 5 S 4 W 4301 332890 15268 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-26-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301 332891 15287 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-28D-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301 332892 15232 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2.30D-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301 332894 15298 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 4-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301 332896 15555 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6.32D.54 32 5 S 4 W 4301 332897 15312 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2-33D-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301 332898 15271 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL '12-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332925 1 5503 OilWell Pror{rreino

17 6t14t2017

ell Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
Iffective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL16-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332775 14762 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332776 14753 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332779 15078 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332780 15280 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332781 15535 OilWell Producin
UTE TRIBAL6-30-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301332783 15163 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL4-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332800 14985 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 5-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332802 14984 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332803 15151 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332804 15185 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332805 15485 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332806 15292 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332807 15317 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332840 14946 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-20-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301332841 15097 OilWell Producing
UTF TRIBAL16-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332842 15015 OilWell Producing
MOONTRIBAL 6-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332843 15113 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-26-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301332844 15233 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 15-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332846 15115 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332847 14956 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 6-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332848 16656 OilWell Producin
U TRIBAL 2-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332849 16959 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL4-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332850 17478 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL8-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332851 16279 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332856 15430 OilWell Producing
ÜŸE TRIBAL 3-30-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301332862 15340 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-19-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301332863 15279 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-19-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301332864 15241 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332865 14947 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332866 14924 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332867 15554 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-26-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301332868 15231 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332869 14970 OilWell Producing
tJTE TRIBAL 8-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332870 15152 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332871 15040 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL6-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332872 15059 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332889 15607 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-26-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301332890 15268 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-26-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301332891 15287 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-28D-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332892 15232 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-30D-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332894 15298 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332896 15555 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-32D-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332897 15312 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-33D-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332898 15271 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332925 15503 OilWell Producing
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ell Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
Iffective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL16-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332775 14762 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332776 14753 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332779 15078 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332780 15280 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332781 15535 OilWell Producin
UTE TRIBAL6-30-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301332783 15163 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL4-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332800 14985 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 5-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332802 14984 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332803 15151 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332804 15185 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332805 15485 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332806 15292 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301332807 15317 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332840 14946 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-20-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301332841 15097 OilWell Producing
UTF TRIBAL16-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332842 15015 OilWell Producing
MOONTRIBAL 6-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332843 15113 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-26-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301332844 15233 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 15-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332846 15115 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332847 14956 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 6-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332848 16656 OilWell Producin
U TRIBAL 2-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332849 16959 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL4-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332850 17478 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL8-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332851 16279 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 25 5 S 4 W 4301332856 15430 OilWell Producing
ÜŸE TRIBAL 3-30-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301332862 15340 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-19-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301332863 15279 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-19-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301332864 15241 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332865 14947 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332866 14924 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332867 15554 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-26-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301332868 15231 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301332869 14970 OilWell Producing
tJTE TRIBAL 8-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332870 15152 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332871 15040 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL6-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332872 15059 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301332889 15607 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-26-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301332890 15268 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-26-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301332891 15287 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-28D-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301332892 15232 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-30D-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332894 15298 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332896 15555 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-32D-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332897 15312 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-33D-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332898 15271 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332925 15503 OilWell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

7
UTE TRIBAL 16.32D.54 32 5 D 4 W 4301332926 1697',! OilWell Producinq
MOON TRIBAL 16-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332927 1s219 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 4-25.55 25 5 S 5 W 4301 332928 '15421 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 7-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 430't332929 1534'l OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5.36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301 332930 1 5301 OilWell Producinq
MOON TRIBAL 10.2-54 2 5 S 4 W 4301332931 15429 OilWell Producing
MYRIN TRIBAL 16.19-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301 332934 1 5339 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 2-3'I-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301 332935 '15428 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 1O-31.55 31 5 S 5 W 4301332936 15354 OilWell Producino
MOON TRIBAL 1-27.54 27 5 S 4 W 4301 332937 1 5308 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 5.23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301 332938 15584 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 7-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301332952 15724 OilWell Producino
ST TRIBAL 5-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301 332953 15781 OilWell Producing
UTE TRTBAL 15-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332971 15310 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 4-'19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332972 1s382 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332973 't5245 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2.20.54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332974 15269 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332976 15311 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1O-15.55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332977 15380 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 1.15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301 332978 15299 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14.15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301 332979 15369 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 11-15.55 15 5 5 5 W 4301 332980 '15342 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14-18.55 18 5 S 5 W 4301332984 15671 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14-24.56 24 5 S 6 W 4301 332988 '15740 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 7.24-56 24 5 S o W 4301 332989 15782 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 11.25.56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332990 15627 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332991 15617 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332992 15648 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301 332993 15561 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 13-15D.54 15 5 S 4 W 4301 333039 1 5368 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301333041 '15377 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14.31D.54 31 5 D 4 W 4301 333042 15419 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4.22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333044 1 5381 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301333046 '15211 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333047 1 5378 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7.35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333048 15367 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15.36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333049 1 5379 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL '10.12.55 12 5 S 5 W 4301 333055 15618 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5.13-54 13 5 S 4 W 4301333075 15873 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301333076 17074 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL '12-18.54 18 5 S 4 W 4301 333077 15575 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 8-33.54 33 5 S 4 W 4301 333089 15398 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL '12-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301 333090 '15417 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301 333091 15397 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 10.33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301 333092 154',t8 OilWell Producino

18 6t1412017

ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

Ëffective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL16-32D-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332926 16971 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL16-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332927 15219 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332928 15421 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332929 15341 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332930 15301 OilWell Producin9
MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 2 5 S 4 W 4301332931 15429 OilWell Producing
MYRIN TRIBAL16-19-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301332934 15339 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-31-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301332935 15428 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-31-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301332936 15354 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL1-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332937 15308 OilWell iProducing
MÕON TRIBAL 5-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332938 15584 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL7-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301332952 15724 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 5-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301332953 15781 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332971 15310 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332972 15382 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332973 15245 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332974 15269 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332976 15311 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332977 15380 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332978 15299 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332979 15369 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332980 15342 _ OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-18-55 18 5 S 5 W 4301332984 15671 OilWell ProducingUTI¯TRIBAL14-24-56 24 5 S 6 W 4301332988 15740 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-24-56 24 5 S 6 W 4301332989 15782 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL11-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332990 15627 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332991 15617 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332992 15648 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332993 15561 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-15D-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301333039 15368 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301333041 15377 OilWell Producing
ÏUfE TRIBAL 14-31D-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301333042 15419 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333044 15381 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301333046 15211 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333047 15378 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333048 15367 OilWell Producin 9
UTE TRIBAL 15-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333049 15379 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-12-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301333055 15618 OilWell Producin 9
UTE TRIBAL 5-13-54 13 5 S 4 W 4301333075 15873 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301333076 17074 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301333077 15575 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301333089 15398 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301333090 15417 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301333091 15397 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301333092 15418 OilWell Producing
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ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

Ëffective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL16-32D-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301332926 16971 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL16-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332927 15219 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301332928 15421 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332929 15341 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301332930 15301 OilWell Producin9
MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 2 5 S 4 W 4301332931 15429 OilWell Producing
MYRIN TRIBAL16-19-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301332934 15339 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-31-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301332935 15428 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-31-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301332936 15354 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL1-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332937 15308 OilWell iProducing
MÕON TRIBAL 5-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301332938 15584 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL7-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301332952 15724 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 5-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301332953 15781 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301332971 15310 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301332972 15382 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332973 15245 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-20-54 20 5 S 4 W 4301332974 15269 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332976 15311 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332977 15380 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332978 15299 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332979 15369 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332980 15342 _ OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-18-55 18 5 S 5 W 4301332984 15671 OilWell ProducingUTI¯TRIBAL14-24-56 24 5 S 6 W 4301332988 15740 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-24-56 24 5 S 6 W 4301332989 15782 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL11-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332990 15627 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332991 15617 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332992 15648 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-25-56 25 5 S 6 W 4301332993 15561 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-15D-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301333039 15368 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301333041 15377 OilWell Producing
ÏUfE TRIBAL 14-31D-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301333042 15419 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-22-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333044 15381 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301333046 15211 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333047 15378 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333048 15367 OilWell Producin 9
UTE TRIBAL 15-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333049 15379 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-12-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301333055 15618 OilWell Producin 9
UTE TRIBAL 5-13-54 13 5 S 4 W 4301333075 15873 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301333076 17074 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301333077 15575 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301333089 15398 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301333090 15417 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301333091 15397 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301333092 15418 OilWell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

UTE TRIBAL 14-33.54 33 5 D 4 W 4301333093 1s399 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 43013331 1 1 16832 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14-'14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333112 15440 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 13-2'I-54 21 5 S 4 W 430'1333113 15471 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL '11-21.54 21 5 S 4 W 43013331 15 15470 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-54 22 5 S 4 W 43013331 16 15662 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2-21-55 21 5 S 5 W 43013331 17 15582 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 4-28-55 28 5 S 5 W 43013331 18 15506 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 8-29.55 29 5 S 5 W 4301 3331 1 I 15507 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6.29.55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333120 15504 OilWell Producing

AYLOR FEE 13-22-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301333121 15525 OilWell Producino
AflLCOX ELTASON 7-15-56 15 5 S 0 W 430',t333122 15526 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 14.16.54 16 5 S 4 W 4301333123 15639 OilWell Producino
,JTE TRIBAL 1-'16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301333128 15420 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 1O-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301333129 15454 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 7.16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301 3331 30 15455 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301333131 15456 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 16-17-54 17 5 S 4 W 4301333132 15524 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 10-17.54 17 5 S 4 W 4301333133 15581 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL '12-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333134 15567 OilWell Producing
A/|LCOX FEE 1-20-56 20 5 S 6 W 4301333150 15745 OilWell Producinq
\IELSEN FEE 13.,I1.56 11 5 S

S
6 W 4301333152 15600 OilWell Producinq

JTE TRIBAL 2.29.54 29 5 4 W 4301 3331 53 15919 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 14.29.54 29 5 S 4 W 4301333154 15831 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL'IO-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 430133315s 15847 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 1O-24D-55 24 5 D 5 W 4301333156 15556 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 10.29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301 3331 57 1 5505 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 6.29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301333172 15846 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 12Q.25.55 25 5 S 5 W 4301 3331 84 15744 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 3G-3,I-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301 333185 15746 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 1I-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333186 15865 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 6-23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301 3331 87 15996 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 8-'14.54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333204 15656 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 10-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333205 15680 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 11.15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301333206 15643 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 9-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301333207 15660 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 3.22.54 22 5 S 4 W 4301333208 15640 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 15-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 430',t333212 15642 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 6-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333213 16831 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 11-36D-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333214 '15702 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 1.22D.54 22 5 S 4 W 4301333215 15641 OilWell Producinq
BERRY TRIBAL 1-23.54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333216 1 5931 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL '15.23.54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333217 15932 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 9-36D-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301 333239 1 5933 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 95-25.55 25 5 S 5 W 4301333245 15962 Oil Wall Producinq

19 6114t2017

Nell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: LinnOperation, LLC
Nective:3/1/2017

UTETRIBAL 14-33-54 33 5 S 4 VV 4301333093 15399 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAI.2-14-5.4 14 5 S 4 VV 4301333111 16832 OilVVell P'roducin 9
UTETRIBAL14-1a‡-54 14 5 S_ 4 VV 4301333112 15440 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAL13-21-54 21 5 S 4 VV 4301333113 15471 OilVVell P'roducirmi
UTETRIBAI.11-21-54 21 5 S 4 VV 4301333115 15470 OilVVell P·roducirmi
UTETRIBAd.11-22-5·4 22 5 S •‡ VV 4301333116 15662 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL2-21-55 21 5 S 5 VV 4301333117 15582 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAL4-28-f¾i 28 5 S 5 VV 4301333118 15506 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAL8-29-!Wi 29 5 S 5 VV 4301333119 15507 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAL6-29-55 29 5 S 5 VV 4301333120 15504 Oil\Nell Producing
TirYLOR FEE 13-22-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301333121 15525 OilVVell Produciri9
WILCOX ELIASON 7-15-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301333122 15526 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.14-16-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301333123 15639 OilVVell Produciri 9
UTETRIBAA.1-16-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301333128 15420 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-16-54 16 5 S_ 4 W 4301333129 15454 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301333130 15455 OilWell Producin9
UTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301333131 15456 OilWell Producin 9UTETRIBA1.16-17-54 17 5 S 4 VV 4301333132 15524 OilVVell Producingi
UTE TRIBAL 10-17-54 17 5 S 4 W 4301333133 15581 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333134 15567 OilWell Producin9
VVllgDOXFEE1-20-56 20 5 S 6 \N 4301333150 15745 OilVVell Producing
NIELSEN FEE 13-11-56 11 5 S 6 W 4301333152 15600 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL2-29-54 29 5 S_ 4 VV 4301333153 15919 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAL14-29-54 29 5 S 4 VV 4301333154 15831 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL10-29-54 29 5 S 4 VV 4301333155 15847 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333156 15556 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333157 15505 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-29-54 29 5 S_ 4 W 4301333172 15846 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12Q-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301333184 15744 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAJ.3G.-31-54 31 5 S 4 \4 4301333185 15746 OilVVell ProducirKI
UTE TRIBAL11-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333186 15865 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301333187 15996 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333204 15656 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333205 15680 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301333206 15643 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.9-16-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301333207 15660 OilVVell Producirgi
LTFETTRIEL4L3-22-54 22 5 S 4 VV 4301333208 15640 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301333212 15642 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333213 16831 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 11-36D-55 36 5 S 5 VV 4301333214 15702 OilVVell P'roducin 9
UTETRIBAL 1-22D-54 22 5 S 4 VV 4301333215 15641 OilVVell Producing
BERRYTRIBAL 1-23-5.‡ 23 5 S 4 VV 4301333216 15931 ÒÏ\lVell Producing
BERRYTRIBAL15-23-54 23 5 S 4 VV 4301333217 15932 Oilmfell Producing
UTE TTilELAL9-36D-55 36 5 S 5 VV 4301333239 15933 OilVVell Producin9
UTE TTilELAL9S-25-55 25 5 S 5 VV 4301333245 15962 OilVVell Producing

19

Nell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: LinnOperation, LLC
Nective:3/1/2017

UTETRIBAL 14-33-54 33 5 S 4 VV 4301333093 15399 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAI.2-14-5.4 14 5 S 4 VV 4301333111 16832 OilVVell P'roducin 9
UTETRIBAL14-1a‡-54 14 5 S_ 4 VV 4301333112 15440 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAL13-21-54 21 5 S 4 VV 4301333113 15471 OilVVell P'roducirmi
UTETRIBAI.11-21-54 21 5 S 4 VV 4301333115 15470 OilVVell P·roducirmi
UTETRIBAd.11-22-5·4 22 5 S •‡ VV 4301333116 15662 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL2-21-55 21 5 S 5 VV 4301333117 15582 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAL4-28-f¾i 28 5 S 5 VV 4301333118 15506 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAL8-29-!Wi 29 5 S 5 VV 4301333119 15507 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAL6-29-55 29 5 S 5 VV 4301333120 15504 Oil\Nell Producing
TirYLOR FEE 13-22-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301333121 15525 OilVVell Produciri9
WILCOX ELIASON 7-15-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301333122 15526 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.14-16-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301333123 15639 OilVVell Produciri 9
UTETRIBAA.1-16-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301333128 15420 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-16-54 16 5 S_ 4 W 4301333129 15454 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301333130 15455 OilWell Producin9
UTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301333131 15456 OilWell Producin 9UTETRIBA1.16-17-54 17 5 S 4 VV 4301333132 15524 OilVVell Producingi
UTE TRIBAL 10-17-54 17 5 S 4 W 4301333133 15581 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333134 15567 OilWell Producin9
VVllgDOXFEE1-20-56 20 5 S 6 \N 4301333150 15745 OilVVell Producing
NIELSEN FEE 13-11-56 11 5 S 6 W 4301333152 15600 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL2-29-54 29 5 S_ 4 VV 4301333153 15919 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAL14-29-54 29 5 S 4 VV 4301333154 15831 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL10-29-54 29 5 S 4 VV 4301333155 15847 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333156 15556 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333157 15505 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-29-54 29 5 S_ 4 W 4301333172 15846 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12Q-25-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301333184 15744 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAJ.3G.-31-54 31 5 S 4 \4 4301333185 15746 OilVVell ProducirKI
UTE TRIBAL11-36-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333186 15865 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301333187 15996 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333204 15656 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333205 15680 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301333206 15643 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.9-16-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301333207 15660 OilVVell Producirgi
LTFETTRIEL4L3-22-54 22 5 S 4 VV 4301333208 15640 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301333212 15642 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333213 16831 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 11-36D-55 36 5 S 5 VV 4301333214 15702 OilVVell P'roducin 9
UTETRIBAL 1-22D-54 22 5 S 4 VV 4301333215 15641 OilVVell Producing
BERRYTRIBAL 1-23-5.‡ 23 5 S 4 VV 4301333216 15931 ÒÏ\lVell Producing
BERRYTRIBAL15-23-54 23 5 S 4 VV 4301333217 15932 Oilmfell Producing
UTE TTilELAL9-36D-55 36 5 S 5 VV 4301333239 15933 OilVVell Producin9
UTE TTilELAL9S-25-55 25 5 S 5 VV 4301333245 15962 OilVVell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

UTE TRIBAL 12.32-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333266 15681 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16.220-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333267 1 5703 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-140.54 't4 5 S 4 W 4301333270 15679 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9S-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301333276 16153 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 430',t333277 15818 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14.280-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301 333278 15817 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301333279 1 8408 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10.18.54 18 5 S 4 W 4301 333300 15747 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 5.21.54 21 5 S 4 W 4301 333324 '15748 OilWell Producin0
UTE TRIBAL 6-31O.54 31 5 S 4 W 4301 333325 16't85 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 16-31D-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301 333326 15800 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 16.13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301 333327 15891 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-13D.55 13 5 S 5 W 4301 333328 15892 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15.21.55 21 5 S 5 W 4301 333357 1579'.1 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1O-23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 43013333s8 '15799 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9.26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301 333359 1 5853 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 1O-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333360 1s8s2 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14.260-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333361 1 5938 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333362 15869 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 3-32D-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333363 1 5936 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 13-'14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333364 15790 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 7-270-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301333365 1 5935 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-32.55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333379 15819 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 13H.16-55 16 5 S 5 W 430't333380 18357 OilWell Producinq
BERRY TRIBAL 7-23.54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333381 1 5934 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 9-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333382 16024 OilWell Producinq
BERRY TRIBAL 7-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301 333383 16102 OilWell Producinq
BERRY TRIBAL 4-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301 333384 16588 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 2-2.65 2 o S 5 W 4301 333385 16150 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 5-4-65 4 o S 5 W 4301 333387 17599 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1A-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301 333393 1707s OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 15-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301 33341 1 16037 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 8.23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333417 't6101 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12.29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301 33341 I 17307 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-24.55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333420 15997 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-25D.55 25 5 S 5 W 4301333421 16589 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 1O-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333422 16038 OitWell Producino
1-15-56 DLB 15 5 S 6 W 4301333447 15854 OilWell
FEDERAL 5-3-64 3 6 S 4 W 4301333448 16098 OilWell
FEDERAL 8.1.64 1 6 S 4 W 4301333449 '16152 OilWell Producing

EDERAL 5-4.64 4 6 S 4 W 4301333450 '17851 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 11.10.65 10 6 S 5 W 4301333451 't6281 OilWell Producino
BERRY TRIBAL 9.23.54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333465 16590 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 6-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333476 16657 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 7.260-55 26 5 s 5 W 4301333477 16658 OilWell Prodrrcino

20 6t14t2017

ellTransfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC
ffective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL12-32-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333266 15681 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL16-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333267 15703 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-14D-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333270 15679 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9S-19-54 19 5 S 4 W 4301333276 16153 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301333277 15818 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-28D-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301333278 15817 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL1-14D-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301333279 18408 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301333300 15747 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301333324 15748 OilWell Producing
UŸE TRIBAL 6-31D-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301333325 16185 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL16-31D-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301333326 15800 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301333327 15891 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-13D-55 _ _ 13 5 S 5 W 4301333328 15892 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301333357 15791 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301333358 15799 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333359 15853 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333360 15852 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333361 15938 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333362 15869 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-32D-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333363 15936 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333364 15790 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 7-27D-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301333365 15935 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-32-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333379 15819 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13H-16-55 16 5 S 5 W 4301333380 18357 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL7-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333381 15934 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL9-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333382 16024 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 7-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333383 16102 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 4-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333384 16588 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL2-2-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301333385 16150 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL5-4-65 4 6 S 5 W 4301333387 17599 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL1A-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301333393 17075 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 15-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333411 16037 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 8-23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333417 16101 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333418 17307 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-24-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333420 15997 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-25D-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301333421 16589 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 10-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333422 16038 OilWell Producin 9
1-15-56 DLB 15 5 S 6 W 4301333447 15854 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 5-3-64 3 6 S 4 W 4301333448 16098 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL8-1-64 1 6 S 4 W 4301333449 16152 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL5-4-64 _ 4 6 S 4 W 4301333450 17851 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 11-10-65 10 6 S 5 W 4301333451 16281 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 9-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333465 16590 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333476 16657 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333477 16658 OilWell Producing

20

ellTransfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC
ffective: 3/1/2017
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UTE TRIBAL 14-28D-54 28 5 S 4 W 4301333278 15817 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL1-14D-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301333279 18408 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-18-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301333300 15747 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301333324 15748 OilWell Producing
UŸE TRIBAL 6-31D-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301333325 16185 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL16-31D-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301333326 15800 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301333327 15891 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-13D-55 _ _ 13 5 S 5 W 4301333328 15892 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301333357 15791 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301333358 15799 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333359 15853 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333360 15852 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333361 15938 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333362 15869 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-32D-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333363 15936 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333364 15790 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 7-27D-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301333365 15935 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-32-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333379 15819 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13H-16-55 16 5 S 5 W 4301333380 18357 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL7-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333381 15934 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL9-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333382 16024 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 7-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333383 16102 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 4-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333384 16588 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL2-2-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301333385 16150 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL5-4-65 4 6 S 5 W 4301333387 17599 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL1A-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301333393 17075 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 15-34-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333411 16037 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 8-23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333417 16101 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333418 17307 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-24-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333420 15997 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-25D-55 25 5 S 5 W 4301333421 16589 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 10-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333422 16038 OilWell Producin 9
1-15-56 DLB 15 5 S 6 W 4301333447 15854 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 5-3-64 3 6 S 4 W 4301333448 16098 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL8-1-64 1 6 S 4 W 4301333449 16152 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL5-4-64 _ 4 6 S 4 W 4301333450 17851 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 11-10-65 10 6 S 5 W 4301333451 16281 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 9-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333465 16590 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333476 16657 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333477 16658 OilWell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
Effective: 31112017
UTE TRIBAL.I.1.26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333478 16659 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301333479 16't51 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 5.6-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301333489 17852 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL.I6.5.65 5 6 S 5 W 4301333490 16833 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 6-11-65 1',| b S 5 W 4301333491 16335 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 14.2-56 2 5 S 6 W 4301333492 1 8358 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 1.31.55 31 5 S 5 W 4301 333501 '17104 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301 333508 17',103 OilWell Producino
BERRY TRIBAL 11.34D.54 34 5 S 4 W 4301 333529 16099 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 2.16D-56 16 5 S 6 W 4301 333538 1 7305 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 4-16-56 16 5 S o W 4301 333539 16272 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 3.17-56 17 5 S 6 W 4301 333541 16459 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4.20D-55 20 5 D 5 W 4301333549 18075 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301 333552 16662 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 8.28-46 28 4 S 6 W 4301 333576 16155 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 7.3.56 3 5 S 6 W 4301 333577 16379 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 3-5.56 5 5 S 6 W 4301333580 17082 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 8.2D-64 2 6 S 4 W 4301333581 16't00 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 13H-3-56 3 5 s E W 4301333591 '18129 OilWell Producinq
LC FEE 6-12-57 12 5 S 7 W 4301333593 17083 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 4.26D.54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333595 16591 OilWell Producino
LC FEE 12H-6-56 5 5 S 6 W 4301333606 uqq

18038
OilWell Producino

LC TRIBAL 7-7D-56 7 5 S 6 W 4301333607 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 1-9-56 I 5 S 6 W 4301333608 16380 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 5-'14-54 14 5 c 4 W 4301333619 16945 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10.26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301 333620 16663 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301 333621 16664 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 13-36D-55 36 5 D 5 W 4301 333624 17744 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 6.26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301 333625 16619 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL'1.220.55 22 5 S 5 W 4301 333626 '16777 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301 333627 16818 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2-27D.55 27 5 S 5 W 4301 333628 16746 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 12-28D.55 28 5 S 5 W 4301 333645 17999 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 13-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 430'1333646 18000 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301 333673 16299 OilWell Producinq
UTE FEE 7-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301 333674 18089 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 9.20D.55 20 5 S 5 W 4301 333675 17309 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 11-17-56 17 5 S o W 4301333677 17600 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333680 16638 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 3-26D.54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333681 16665 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333682 '17031 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 'IO.27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301333683 16666 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL '14-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301333684 16667 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 12-21D,-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301333694 16296 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 5-21D.55 21 5 S 5 W 4301333706 16298 OilWell Producino

21 6t14t2017

ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

Uffective:3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL11-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333478 16659 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14Q-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301333479 16151 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 5-6-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301333489 17852 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 16-5-65 5 6 S 5 VV 4301333490 16833 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL6-11-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301333491 16335 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL14-2-56 2 5 S 6 VV 4301333492 18358 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAA.1-31-55 31 5 S 5 VV 4301333501 17104 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301333508 17103 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 11-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333529 16099 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 2-16D-56 16 5 S 6 W 4301333538 17305 OilWell Producing
LCTRIIBAJ.4-16-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301333539 16272 OilVVell Producirt3
LC TRIBAL3-17-56 17 5 S 6 W

_

4301333541 16459 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-20D-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333549 18075 OilWell Producing
UTETTRIELAL8-23D-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301333552 16662 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL8-28-46 28 4 S 6 W 4301333576 16155 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 7-3-56 3 5 S 6 W 4301333577 16379 OilWell Producir
LC TRIBAL 3-5-56 5 5 S 6 W 4301333580 17082 OilWell Producing
FEDEFLAL8-:2D-64 2 6 S 4 VV 4301333581 16100 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL13H-3-56 3 5 S 6 W 4301333591 18129 OilWell Producing
LC Fj¯E6-12-57 12 5 S 7 VV 4301333593 17083 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333595 16591 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 12H-6-56 6 5 S 6 VV 4301333606 18037 Oil\¾ell Producing
LC TRIBAL7-7D-56 7 5 S 6 W 4301333607 18038 OilWell Producing
LC_TR_IBAL1-9-56 9 5 S 6 W 4301333608 16380 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333619 16945 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333620 16663 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333621 16664 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-36D-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333624 17744 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333625 16619 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL1-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333626 16777 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301333627 16818 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301333628 16746 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333645 17999 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333646 18000 Oil Well Produc
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333673 16299 OilWell Producing
UTE FEE 7-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301333674 18089 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-20D-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333675 17309 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL11-17-56i 17 5 S 6 VV 4301333677 17600 Oil\Nell_ Producing
lJTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333680 16638 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333681 16665 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333682 17031 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 10-27D-55 27 5 S 5 VV 4301333683 16666 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301333684 16667 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-21D-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301333694 16296 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-21D-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301333706 16298 OilWell Producing

21

ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

Uffective:3/1/2017
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BERRY TRIBAL 11-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333529 16099 OilWell Producing
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_
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FEDEFLAL8-:2D-64 2 6 S 4 VV 4301333581 16100 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL13H-3-56 3 5 S 6 W 4301333591 18129 OilWell Producing
LC Fj¯E6-12-57 12 5 S 7 VV 4301333593 17083 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333595 16591 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 12H-6-56 6 5 S 6 VV 4301333606 18037 Oil\¾ell Producing
LC TRIBAL7-7D-56 7 5 S 6 W 4301333607 18038 OilWell Producing
LC_TR_IBAL1-9-56 9 5 S 6 W 4301333608 16380 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333619 16945 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333620 16663 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333621 16664 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-36D-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333624 17744 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333625 16619 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL1-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333626 16777 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301333627 16818 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301333628 16746 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333645 17999 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333646 18000 Oil Well Produc
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333673 16299 OilWell Producing
UTE FEE 7-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301333674 18089 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-20D-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333675 17309 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL11-17-56i 17 5 S 6 VV 4301333677 17600 Oil\Nell_ Producing
lJTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333680 16638 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333681 16665 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333682 17031 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 10-27D-55 27 5 S 5 VV 4301333683 16666 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301333684 16667 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-21D-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301333694 16296 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-21D-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301333706 16298 OilWell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

1

UTE TRIBAL 2-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333714 16854 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 7-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333715 16853 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 13.22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333716 16668 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14.22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333717 16669 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 7-220.55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333721 16670 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 1O-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333722 '16671 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 3.29-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333723 16857 OilWell Producinq
BERRY TRIBAL 1O-23D.54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333724 16592 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL'I 1 -23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333725 16672 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 4.24D.55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333726 16673 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6-6D.64 o 6 S 4 W 4301 333745 17084 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301 333768 17450 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 1-14D.54 14 5 S 4 W 4301 333769 17483 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 12-35D-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301 333782 16856 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301 333783 16855 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 1.28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301 333784 16852 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 16-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301 333786 17800 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 9.28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301 333787 16887 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 7-280-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301 333788 16886 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 11.32D-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301 333793 17003 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 9-14D-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333796 17482 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 4-270-55 27 5 S 5 W

W
4301333797 16700 OilWell Producinq

:OY TRIBAL 12H-33-55 33 5 S 5 4301333799 18232 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 9.32D-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333800 18361 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 12.260-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333801 16639 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 8-26D.55 26 5 S 5 W 43013338s9 17859 OilWell Producinq
3ERRY TRIBAL 2-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301 333867 17889 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 3-35D.55 35 5 S 5 W 4301 333888 17421 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 10.32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301333902 16819 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL '12.31D-54 31 5 S 4 W 4301 333907 17480 OilWell Producino

TRIBAL 12.23D-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301 333908 17g',t4 OilWell Producing
TRIBAL 14.2OD.55 20 5 S 5 W 4301 333909 18559 OilWell Producino

JTE TRIBAL 6-20D.55 20 5 S 5 W 4301 33391 0 18481 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-20.55 20 5 S 5 W 4301 33391 1 18520 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 14-24D.55 24 5 S 5 W 4301 333912 16943 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL '14-230-55 23 5 S 5 W 43013339't5 17457 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 1.15D-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301333916 16889 OilWell Producinq
ST TRIBAL 7.15D-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301333950 16972 OilWell Producinq
ST TRIBAL 9.15D-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301333951 16973 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 15-35D-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333954 17417 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14-35D-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333955 '17416 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333965 17418 OilWell Producinq

:DERAL 1-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301333966 16888 OilWell Producinq
IE TRIBAL 1-35D-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333967 '17420 OilWell Producinq
rE TRIBAL 1O-36D-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333968 17743 OilWell Producino

22 6t14t20'.t7

Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
:Hective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL2-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333714 16854 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333715 16853 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333716 16668 OilWell Producing
UTETTRIBAL 14-22D-55 22 5 S 5 VV 4301333717 16669 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333721 16670 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333722 16671 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-29-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333723 16857 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL10-23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333724 16592 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL11-23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333725 16672 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333726 16673 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301333745 17084 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333768 17450 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333769 17483 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 12:-350-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301333782 16856 Oilwiell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333783 16855 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333784 16852 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W

_

4301333786 17800 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333787 16887 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333788 16886 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-32D-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301333793 17003 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-14D-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333796 17482 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301333797 16700 OilWell Producing
FOY TRIBAL12H-33-55 33 5 S 5 W 4301333799 18232 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-32D-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333800 18361 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333801 16639 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333859 17859 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL2-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333867 17889 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL3-35D-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301333888 17421 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301333902 16819 OilWell Producing
UTETTilBAL 12-31D-54 31 5 S 4 VV 4301333907 17480 OilVVell P·roducing
UTETRIBAI.12-:23D-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301333908 17814 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-20D-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333909 18559 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-20D-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333910 18481 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333911 18520 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333912 16943 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.14-23D-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301333915 17457 OilVVell Producingi
ST TRIBAL 1-150-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301333916 16889 OilWell Producing
STTRIBAL7-15D-54 15 5 S 4 VV 4301333950 16972 Oil\Nell Producing
ST TRIBAL9-15D-54 15 5 S 4 W _|430133395116973 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-35D-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333954 17417 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.14-35D-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301333955 17416 OilVVell Producirig
UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333965 17418 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 1-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301333966 16888 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.1-35D-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301333967 17420 OilVVell P'roducing
UTE TRIBAL10-36D-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333968 17743 OilWell Producing
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Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
:Hective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL2-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333714 16854 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-29D-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333715 16853 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333716 16668 OilWell Producing
UTETTRIBAL 14-22D-55 22 5 S 5 VV 4301333717 16669 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333721 16670 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-22D-55 22 5 S 5 W 4301333722 16671 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-29-55 29 5 S 5 W 4301333723 16857 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL10-23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333724 16592 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL11-23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333725 16672 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333726 16673 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301333745 17084 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333768 17450 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333769 17483 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 12:-350-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301333782 16856 Oilwiell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333783 16855 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333784 16852 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W

_

4301333786 17800 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333787 16887 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301333788 16886 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-32D-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301333793 17003 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-14D-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301333796 17482 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-27D-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301333797 16700 OilWell Producing
FOY TRIBAL12H-33-55 33 5 S 5 W 4301333799 18232 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-32D-55 32 5 S 5 W 4301333800 18361 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-54 26 5 S 4 W 4301333801 16639 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333859 17859 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL2-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333867 17889 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL3-35D-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301333888 17421 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-32-54 32 5 S 4 W 4301333902 16819 OilWell Producing
UTETTilBAL 12-31D-54 31 5 S 4 VV 4301333907 17480 OilVVell P·roducing
UTETRIBAI.12-:23D-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301333908 17814 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-20D-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333909 18559 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-20D-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333910 18481 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301333911 18520 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-24D-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301333912 16943 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.14-23D-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301333915 17457 OilVVell Producingi
ST TRIBAL 1-150-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301333916 16889 OilWell Producing
STTRIBAL7-15D-54 15 5 S 4 VV 4301333950 16972 Oil\Nell Producing
ST TRIBAL9-15D-54 15 5 S 4 W _|430133395116973 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-35D-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301333954 17417 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.14-35D-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301333955 17416 OilVVell Producirig
UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333965 17418 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 1-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301333966 16888 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAI.1-35D-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301333967 17420 OilVVell P'roducing
UTE TRIBAL10-36D-55 36 5 S 5 W 4301333968 17743 OilWell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

TRIBAL 4-26D.55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333978 17455 OilWell Producinq
TRIBAL 2-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333979 17456 OilWell Producinq
RY TRIBAL 14.230-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333989 17903 OilWell Producinq
ERAL 3-2D-65 2 o S 5 W 4301334001 't6944 OilWell Producinq
TRIBAL 13-26D.55 26 5 S 5 W 4301334002 17481 OilWell Producinq
ERAL 7.1D-65 1 6 S 5 W 4301334015 17775 OilWell Producinq
ERAL 2.2D.64 2 6 S 4 W 4301334018 17086 OilWell Producinq

:EDERAL 7.6D.64 6 6 S 4 W 4301334020 1 7085 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 6-35D.55 35 5 S 5 W 4301334028 17785 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL '16-26.54 26 5 S 4 W 4301334042 17413 OilWell Producino
sERRY TRIBAL 13-23.54 23 5 S 4 W 4301334043 17100 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 6-28D-55 28 5 S 5 W 4301334056 1 8593 OilWell Producing
JTE TRIBAL 11-28.55 28 5 S 5 W 4301334057 18001 OilWell Producino
JTE TRIBAL 8-270-55 27 5 S 5 W 4301334058 17842 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 3.15D-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301334059 17477 OilWell Producino
ST TRIBAL 5-15D-54 15 5 S 4 W 4301334060 17479 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 7-11D-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301334061 17776 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 7-3D-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301334065 17124 OilWell Producinq
MOON TRIBAL 9-27D-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301334108 19095 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL '16-27D-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301334109 '17414 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 15.22D-54 22 5 S 4 W 43013341 16 't7415 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 13-35D.55 35 E

5
S
S

5 W 43013341',t7 18442 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 12.26D.55 26 5 W 43013341 18 17786 OilWell Producinq
:EDERAL 11-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301334284 17615 OilWell Producinq
=EDERAL 14-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 430'.t334285 17616 OilWell Producinq
:EDERAL 2-60.64 b 6 S 4 W 4301334286 17653 OilWell Producinq
=EDERAL 3-5D-64 5 6 S 4 W 4301334287 17617 OilWell Producinq
:EDERAL 6-5D.64 5 6 S 4 W 430't334288 17649 OilWell Producinq
SFW TRIBAL 1O-1OD-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301 334295 17564 OilWell Producino
SFW TRIBAL 9.10D-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301334296 17565 OilWell Producino
GALLOWAY 3-'118.2 11 2 S 2 W 4301334304 18527 OilWell Producinq
STATE TRIBAL 16.10.54 10 5 S 4 W 4301350245 17553 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 6-14D-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301350246 't7602 OilWell Producing
SFW FEE 15-10.54 10 5 S 4 W 430'.t350247 17566 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 5-5D.64 5 6 S 4 W 4301 350259 't7648 OilWell Producing
.c TRTBAL 6-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301350260 17567 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 12.6D.64 6 6 S 4 W 4301350261 17618 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 4-5D-64 5 6 S 4 W 4301350263 17661 OilWell Producing

:DERAL 1-6-64 b 6 S 4 W 4301350266 17662 OilWell Producinq
iDERAL 4.6D-64 b 6 S 4 W 4301350267 17651 OilWell Producinq
:DERAL 3-6D-64 6 b S 4 W 4301350268 17650 OilWell Producinq
:DERAL 5-6D.64 6 o S 4 W 4301350269 17652 OilWell
:DERAL 8-6D-64 6 o S 4 W 4301350325 17664 OilWell Producinq
:DERAL 1O-1D-65 1 o S 5 W 4301350326 't8027 OilWell Producino

=DERAL 
11.1D.65 1 o 5 5 W 4301350327 18039 OilWell Producino

23 6t1412017

Vell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.

¯o: Linn Operation, LLC
ffective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL4-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333978 17455 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL2-26D-55 26 5 S 5 VV 4301333979 17456 Oil\Nell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL14-23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333989 17903 OilWell Producing
FET)EFLAL3-2D-65 2 6 S 5 VV 4301334001 16944 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301334002 17481 OilWell Producing
FMËDERAJ.7-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301334015 17775 OilVVell Producing
FEJ3EFLAL2-2D-64 2 6 S 4 VV 4301334018 17086 OilvVell Producing
FEJ3EFLAL7-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301334020 17085 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-35D-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301334028 17785 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-26-54 26 5 S 4 VV 4301334042 17413 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 13-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301334043 17100 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL6-28D-55 28 5 S 5 VV 4301334056 18593 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL 11-28-55 28 5 S 5 VV 4301334057 18001 Oilwiell Producing
UTETRIBAI.8-27D-55 27 5 S 5 VV 4301334058 17842 OilVVell Producing
STTRIBAA.3-15D-54 15 5 S 4 VV 4301334059 17477 OilVVell Producing
STTRIBAA.5-150-54 15 5 S 4 \N 4301334060 17479 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL7-11D-65 11 6 S 5 \N 4301334061 17776 OilVVell Producingi
FEDERAL7-3D-65 3 6 S 5 VV 4301334065 17124 Clil\Nell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 9-27D-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301334108 19095 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL16-27D-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301334109 17414 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-22D-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301334116 17415 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBA1.13-35D-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301334117 18442 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAI.12-26D-55 26 5 S 5 VV 4301334118 17786 OilVVell Producing
FET)EFLAL11-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301334284 17615 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 14-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301334285 17616 OilWell Pr
FE13EFLAL2-ISD-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301334286 17663 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFt4L3-50-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301334287 17617 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL6-5D-64 5 6 S 4 W 4301334288 17649 OilWell Producing
SFVVTRIBAL10-10D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301334295 17564 OilVVell Producing
SF\NTRIBAL9-10D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301334296 17565 OilVVell Producin9
GALLOWAY 3-11B2 11 2 S 2 W 4301334304 18527 OilWell Producing
STATETRIBAL16-10-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301350245 17553 Oil\Nell Producin 9UTETRIBAL6-14D-55 14 5 S 5 VV 4301350246 17602 OilVVell Producin9
SFVVFEE 15-10-5.4 10 5 S 4 VV 4301350247 17566 OilVVell Producing
FEDERALS-5D-6.4 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350259 17648 Oil\Nell Producing
LC TRIBAL6-22D-56 22 5 S \6 W 4301350260 17567 OilWell Producin9
FEDERAL 12-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350261 17618 Oil\Nell Producin 9
FEDERAL4-SD-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350263 17661 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDERAd.1-6-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350266 17662 OilVVell Producing
FEDERid.4-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350267 17651 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL3-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301350268 17650 OilWell Pr
FEDERAL5-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301350269 17652 OilWell _ Producing
FEDERAL6;-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350325 17664 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDEFLAL10-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350326 18027 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 11-1D-65 1 6 S 5 W 4301350327 18039 OilWell Producing
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Vell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.

¯o: Linn Operation, LLC
ffective: 3/1/2017
UTE TRIBAL4-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301333978 17455 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL2-26D-55 26 5 S 5 VV 4301333979 17456 Oil\Nell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL14-23D-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301333989 17903 OilWell Producing
FET)EFLAL3-2D-65 2 6 S 5 VV 4301334001 16944 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-26D-55 26 5 S 5 W 4301334002 17481 OilWell Producing
FMËDERAJ.7-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301334015 17775 OilVVell Producing
FEJ3EFLAL2-2D-64 2 6 S 4 VV 4301334018 17086 OilvVell Producing
FEJ3EFLAL7-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301334020 17085 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-35D-55 35 5 S 5 W 4301334028 17785 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-26-54 26 5 S 4 VV 4301334042 17413 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 13-23-54 23 5 S 4 W 4301334043 17100 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL6-28D-55 28 5 S 5 VV 4301334056 18593 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL 11-28-55 28 5 S 5 VV 4301334057 18001 Oilwiell Producing
UTETRIBAI.8-27D-55 27 5 S 5 VV 4301334058 17842 OilVVell Producing
STTRIBAA.3-15D-54 15 5 S 4 VV 4301334059 17477 OilVVell Producing
STTRIBAA.5-150-54 15 5 S 4 \N 4301334060 17479 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL7-11D-65 11 6 S 5 \N 4301334061 17776 OilVVell Producingi
FEDERAL7-3D-65 3 6 S 5 VV 4301334065 17124 Clil\Nell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 9-27D-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301334108 19095 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL16-27D-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301334109 17414 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL15-22D-54 22 5 S 4 W 4301334116 17415 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBA1.13-35D-55 35 5 S 5 VV 4301334117 18442 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAI.12-26D-55 26 5 S 5 VV 4301334118 17786 OilVVell Producing
FET)EFLAL11-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301334284 17615 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 14-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301334285 17616 OilWell Pr
FE13EFLAL2-ISD-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301334286 17663 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFt4L3-50-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301334287 17617 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL6-5D-64 5 6 S 4 W 4301334288 17649 OilWell Producing
SFVVTRIBAL10-10D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301334295 17564 OilVVell Producing
SF\NTRIBAL9-10D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301334296 17565 OilVVell Producin9
GALLOWAY 3-11B2 11 2 S 2 W 4301334304 18527 OilWell Producing
STATETRIBAL16-10-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301350245 17553 Oil\Nell Producin 9UTETRIBAL6-14D-55 14 5 S 5 VV 4301350246 17602 OilVVell Producin9
SFVVFEE 15-10-5.4 10 5 S 4 VV 4301350247 17566 OilVVell Producing
FEDERALS-5D-6.4 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350259 17648 Oil\Nell Producing
LC TRIBAL6-22D-56 22 5 S \6 W 4301350260 17567 OilWell Producin9
FEDERAL 12-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350261 17618 Oil\Nell Producin 9
FEDERAL4-SD-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350263 17661 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDERAd.1-6-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350266 17662 OilVVell Producing
FEDERid.4-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350267 17651 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL3-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301350268 17650 OilWell Pr
FEDERAL5-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301350269 17652 OilWell _ Producing
FEDERAL6;-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350325 17664 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDEFLAL10-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350326 18027 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 11-1D-65 1 6 S 5 W 4301350327 18039 OilWell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

3t1
FEDERAL 12-1D-65 1 o S 5 ul/ 4301350328 18040 OilWell Produclng
FEDERAL 13-1D-65 1 o S 5 W 4301350329 18042 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 14.1D-65 1 o S 5 W 4301 350330 18041 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 13-5D-64 5 o S 4 W 4301350337 17714 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 14.5D-64 5 o S 4 W 4301 350338 '17715 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 9-1D.65 ,|

o S 5 W 4301350342 18026 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 13-6D.64 6 o S 4 W 4301350347 '17619 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 11-5D.64 5 o S 4 W 4301350348 17690 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 12-5D.64 5 o S 4 W 4301 350349 17713 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 8-1D-65 1 6 S 5 W 4301 350350 18025 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 3-140-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301 350389 17904 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 1.34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301350408 17931 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7.14-54 14 5 S 4 W 4301 350409 't7924 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-21D-55 2',! 5 S 5 W 4301 350435 17963 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-34D.55 34 5 S 5 W 4301350436 '17952 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5.16D-54 't6 5 S 4 W 4301350475 17991 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 12.14D-55 14 5 S 5 uV 4301350476 17973 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-15D-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301350477 17974 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301350478 18002 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-14-55 't4 5 S 5 W 4301350479 18021 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-1OD-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301350488 18099 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-34.55 34 5 S 5 W 4301 35051 0 17949 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 44D-65 4 6 S 5 W 4301350521 18557 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6.3D.64 3 6 S 4 W 4301350522 't8073 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 1.1D-64 1 6 S 4 W 4301350524 1 8088 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 7-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301350525 18100 OilWell Producino
BERRY TRI BAL'12-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301350527 17998 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 15-5D.65 5 6 S 5 W 4301350s53 1 8537 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 'I'I4D-64 4 6 S 4 W 4301350565 18043 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 6-6D-65 o 6 S 5 W 4301350566 18521 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 3..I5D-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301350598 18097 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 9-16D-56 16 5 S c W 43013s0600 19544 OilWell Producino
LC FEE 16-16D-56 16 5 S , W 4301350601 18165 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 1O-16D-56 16 5 S c W 4301350602 18586 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL '15-22D-56 22 5 S t W 4301350606 18278 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 5-23D-56 23 5 S , W 4301350625 18285 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 5.14D-56 14 5 S , W 4301350661 't82',t9 OilWell Producino
SFW FEE 14.10D-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301350686 18070 OilWell Producing
LC FEE'.t-22D-56 22 5 S c W 4301 35071 I 18101 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 8.2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 430'1350719 18614 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL'I-2D-64 2 6 S 4 W 4301 350730 18585 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 7-2D-64 2 6 S 4 W 4301 350734 18584 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 1O-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301 350735 '18'162 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 4.3D-64 3 6 S 4 W 4301 350736 18621 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 12.30-64 3 o S 4 W 4301 350737 18620 OilWell Producino

24 6t14t2017

ell Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC

¯ffective: 3/1/2017
FEDERAL 12-1D-65 1 6 S 5 W 4301350328 18040 OilWell Producing

EÏDEFL4L13-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350329 18042 OilVVell Producirmi
FEDEFLAL14-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350330 18041 OilVVell Producirx¡
FEDEFLAL13-5D-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350337 17714 OilVVell Produciry)
FEDEFMsL14-5D-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350338 17715 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDEFLAL9-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350342 18026 OilVVell Producirg;
FEDERAL13-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350347 17619 Oil\Neil Producing
FEDEFLAL11-5D-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350348 17690 OilVVell Producing
FEEDEFLAL12-5D-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350349 17713 OilVVell Producirmi
FEDEFL4L8-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350350 18025 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL3-14D-54 14 5 S 4 VV 4301350389 17904 OilVVell Produciry¡
UTE TRIBAL1-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301350408 17931 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL7-14-54 14 5 S 4 VV 4301350409 17924 OilVVell Producirg;
UTE TRIBAL8-21D-55 21 5 S 5 W 4301350435 17963 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301350436 17952 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL5-16D-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301350475 17991 OilVVell Producirg¡
UTETRIBAL 12-14D-55 14 5 S 5 VV 4301350476 17973 Oil½/ell P'roducirmi
UTE TRIBAL 8-15D-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301350477 17974 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301350478 18002 OilWell Producing
lJTE TRIBAL 5-14-55 14 5 S 5 VV 4301350479 18021 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-10D-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301350488 18099 OilWell Producing
UÌE TRIBAL 7-34-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301350510 17949 OilWell Producing
FEDEFDAL4-4D-65 4 6 S 5 VV 4301350521 18557 OilVVell PToducirmi
FEDEFLAL6-3D-64 3 6 S 4 VV 4301350522 18073 OilVVell PToducirmi
FEDERAL 1-1D-64 1 6 S 4 W 4301350524 18088 OilWell Producing
FEDEFL4L7-2D-65 2 6 S 5 VV 4301350525 18100 OilVVell Producing
BEÑRRY1TRIBAL12-34D-54 34 5 S 4 VV 4301350527 17998 OilVVell Producin
I EDERAL 15-5D-65 5 6 S 5 W 4301350553 18537 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL114EB64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301350565 18043 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDEFLAL6-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301350566 18521 OilVVell P'roducirmi
LCTRIBAL3-15D-56 15 5 S 6 VV 4301350598 18097 OilVVell P'roduciry¡
LCTRIBALL9-16D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301350600 19544 OilVVell PToducirgi

LC FEE 16-160-56 16 5 S 6 VV ¡4301350601 18165 OilVVell - Produciry)
LC.TRIBAL10-16D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301350602 18586 OilVVell Producirmi
LC TRIBAL15-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301350606 18278 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL5-23D-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301350625 18285 OilvVell Producing
LCTRIBAL5-14D-56 14 5 S 6 VV 4301350661 18219 OilVVell PToducirgi
SFVVFEE 14-10D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301350686 18070 OilVVell Producirx¡
LC FEE 1-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301350718 18101 OilWell Producing
FIÉDERAL8-2D-65 2 6 S 5 VV 4301350719 18614 Oil \¾ell Producing
FEDEFLAL1-2D-64 2 6 S 4 VV 4301350730 18585 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 7-2D-64 2 6 S 4 W 4301350734 18584 OilWell Producing
FEDEFLAL10-6D-6.4 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350735 18162 OilVVell Producirg¡
FEDEFLAL4-3D-64 3 6 S 4 VV 4301350736 18621 OilVVell Producirmi
FEDEPJsL12-3D-64 3 6 S 4 VV 4301350737 18620 Oil\¾ell Producing

24
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fo: Linn Operation, LLC
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EÏDEFL4L13-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350329 18042 OilVVell Producirmi
FEDEFLAL14-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350330 18041 OilVVell Producirx¡
FEDEFLAL13-5D-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350337 17714 OilVVell Produciry)
FEDEFMsL14-5D-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350338 17715 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDEFLAL9-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350342 18026 OilVVell Producirg;
FEDERAL13-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301350347 17619 Oil\Neil Producing
FEDEFLAL11-5D-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350348 17690 OilVVell Producing
FEEDEFLAL12-5D-64 5 6 S 4 VV 4301350349 17713 OilVVell Producirmi
FEDEFL4L8-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350350 18025 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL3-14D-54 14 5 S 4 VV 4301350389 17904 OilVVell Produciry¡
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UÌE TRIBAL 7-34-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301350510 17949 OilWell Producing
FEDEFDAL4-4D-65 4 6 S 5 VV 4301350521 18557 OilVVell PToducirmi
FEDEFLAL6-3D-64 3 6 S 4 VV 4301350522 18073 OilVVell PToducirmi

FEDERAL 1-1D-64 1 6 S 4 W 4301350524 18088 OilWell Producing
FEDEFL4L7-2D-65 2 6 S 5 VV 4301350525 18100 OilVVell Producing
BEÑRRY1TRIBAL12-34D-54 34 5 S 4 VV 4301350527 17998 OilVVell Producin
I EDERAL 15-5D-65 5 6 S 5 W 4301350553 18537 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL114EB64 4 6 S 4 VV 4301350565 18043 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDEFLAL6-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301350566 18521 OilVVell P'roducirmi
LCTRIBAL3-15D-56 15 5 S 6 VV 4301350598 18097 OilVVell P'roduciry¡
LCTRIBALL9-16D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301350600 19544 OilVVell PToducirgi

LC FEE 16-160-56 16 5 S 6 VV ¡4301350601 18165 OilVVell - Produciry)
LC.TRIBAL10-16D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301350602 18586 OilVVell Producirmi
LC TRIBAL15-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301350606 18278 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL5-23D-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301350625 18285 OilvVell Producing
LCTRIBAL5-14D-56 14 5 S 6 VV 4301350661 18219 OilVVell PToducirgi
SFVVFEE 14-10D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301350686 18070 OilVVell Producirx¡
LC FEE 1-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301350718 18101 OilWell Producing
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FEDEPJsL12-3D-64 3 6 S 4 VV 4301350737 18620 Oil\¾ell Producing

24



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

C TRIBAL 3.21D-56 21 5 S o W 4301 350751 18462 OilWell Producing
C TRIBAL 5-21D.56 21 5 S b W 4301 350752 18286 OilWell Producino

FEDERAL 2-1D€5 1 6 S 5 W 4301 350759 18172 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 3-1D.65 1 o S 5 W 4301350760 18173 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 5.1D-65 1 o S 5 W 4301 350761 18174 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 9-2D-65 2 o S 5 W 4301350762 't8245 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 11.2D.65 2 b S 5 W 4301 350763 1 8589 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 15-2D-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301 350764 1 8590 OilWell Producinq
c TRTBAL 14-14D-56 14 5 S 6 W 4301 350776 't8287 OilWell Producino

LC FEE 2-20D-56 20 5 S 6 W 4301350777 18622 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL '12-22D-56 22 5 S o W 4301350780 't8341 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 3-4D-65 4 o S 5 W 4301350782 18556 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 6-4D-65 4 o S 5 W 4301350783 19162 OilWell
FEDERAL'124D.65 4 6 S 5 W 4301350784 19171 OilWell
LC TRIBAL 14-15D.56 15 5 S 6 W 4301350834 18362 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 7_2'1D.54 21 5 S 4 W 4301350852 18423 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8L-21D.54 21 5 S 4 W 4301 350853 18423 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 1OS-21D-54 2',1 5 S 4 W 4301350854 18423 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 11-'11-54 ',1 5 S 4 W 4301350861 18775 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 1-28D-56 28 5 S 6 W 4301350865 1 9575 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 2-28D-56 28 5 S o W 4301350866 18592 OilWell Producino
LC FEE 8-28D-56 28 5 S 6 W 4301 350867 18342 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 6-27D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301 350868 18480 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 15-23D-56 23 5 S 6 W 4301 350870 18410 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 15-26-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301 350871 18377 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 16-11-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301 350888 18707 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 2-5D-56 5 5 S b W 4301 350925 18568 OilWell Producinq
tC TRIBAL 2-9D.56 9 5 S t) W 4301 350926 't8425 OilWell Producino
rc FEE 8-29-45 29 4 S 5 W 4301 3s0928 18313 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 13-29-45 29 4 S 5 W 4301350929 18426 OilWell Producino
LC FEE 9J12D-57 12 5 S 7 W 4301350963 '18541 OilWell Producino
LC FEE 1-22-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301350965 1 8558 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 11-3D.56 3 5 S 6 W 4301350966 18464 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 3-34-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301350976 18661 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 9.10D-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301350987 '18944 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 10.9D.56 I 5 S 6 W 4301350990 18864 OilWell Producinq
LC FEE 10-31D-45 31 4 S 5 W 4301 350994 18443 OitWell Producing
VIEIRA TRIBAL 4.4-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301 350997 18747 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 10-21.56 21 5 S 6 W 4301 350999 18439 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 1-5D-64 5 6 S 4 W 430',t351012 18720 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 2-5D.64 5 6 S 4 W 4301 351 01 3 18723 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 7.5D.64 5 6 S 4 W 4301 351 014 't8722 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 8-5D.64 5 6 S 4 W 430't3s101s 18721 OilWell Producing
MYRIN TRIBAL 15-10-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301351024 18771 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 15-15D-56 15 5 S o W 4301 351 030 18440 OilWell Producino

25 6t14t2017

Nell Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC
:Nective: 3/1/2017
LCTRIBAL3-21D-56 21 5 S 6 VV 4301350751 18462 Oil\¾ell Producing
LCTRIBAL5-21D-56 21 5 S 6 VV 4301350752 18286 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDERAL2-1DMS5 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350759 18172 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDEFLAL3-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301350760 18173 OilVVell Producirm
FEDERAL 5-1D-65 1 6 S 5 W 4301350761 18174 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL9-2D-65 2 6 S 5 VV 4301350762 18245 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDEFL4L11-2D-65 2 6 S 5 VV 4301350763 18589 OilVVell Producirm
FEDEFLAL15-2D-65 2 6 S 5 VV 4301350764 18590 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL14-14D-56 14 5 S 6 W 4301350776 18287 OilWell Producing
LCFEE2-20D-56 20 5 S 6 VV 4301350777 18622 OilVVell PToducing
LC TRIBAL 12-22D-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301350780 18341 Oil½/ell PToducing
FEDEFLAL3-40-65 4 6 S 5 VV 4301350782 18556 OilVVell Producingi
FEDERAL 6-4D-65 4 6 S 5 VV 4301350783 19162 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 12-4D-65 4 6 S 5 W 4301350784 19171 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL14-15D-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301350834 18362 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL71-21D-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301350852 18423 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8L-21D-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301350853 18423 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL10S-21D-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301350854 18423 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 11-11-54 11 5 S -4 VV 4301350861 18775 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL1-28D-56 28 5 S 6 W 4301350865 19575 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL2-28D-56 28 5 S 6 W 4301350866 18592 OilWell Producing
LC FEE8-:280-56 28 5 S 6 VV 4301350867 18342 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL 6-27D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301350868 18480 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 15-23D-56 23 5 S 6 W 4301350870 18410 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 15-26-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301350871 18377 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-11-55 11 5 S 5 W 4301350888 18707 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL2-5D-56 5 5 S 6 VV 4301350925 18568 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL2-9D-56 9 5 S 6 VV 4301350926 18425 Oil\Nell Producing
LC FEE 8-29-45 29 4 S 5 W 4301350928 18313 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 13-:29-.45 29 4 S 5 VV 4301350929 18426 OilVVell Producing
LC FEE9-12D-57 12 5 S 7 VV 4301350963 18541 OilVVell Producing
LCFEE1-22-57 22 5 S 7 Bl 4301350965 18558 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTTRIBAL11-3D-56 3 5 S 6 VV 4301350966 18464 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL3-34-45 34 4 S 5 W 4301350976 18661 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 9-10D-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301350987 18944 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL10-9D-56 9 5 S 6 W 4301350990 18864 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 10-31D-45 31 4 S 5 VV 4301350994 18443 OilVVell Producing
VIEIRATRIBAL4-4-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301350997 18747 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL 10-21-56 21 5 S 6 VV 4301350999 18439 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDERAL 1-5D-64 5 6 S 4 W 4301351012 18720 OilWell
FEDERAL2-5D-6.4 5 6 S 4 VV 4301351013 18723 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDERAL7-5DMS4 5 6 S 4 VV 4301351014 18722 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDERAL8-5DMS4 5 6 S 4 VV 4301351015 18721 Oil\Nell Producing
MYRINTRIBAL 15-10-55 10 5 S 5 W 4301351024 18771 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL15-15D-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301351030 18440 OilWell Producing
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FEDERAL8-5DMS4 5 6 S 4 VV 4301351015 18721 Oil\Nell Producing
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25



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

LC TRIBAL 9-15D.56 15 5 S 6 W 4301351031 18441 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 6-28.45 28 4 S 5 W 43013s1034 18700 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 1-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301351055 18739 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 8.12D-65 't2 o S 5 W 4301351056 '18718 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 2-'I2D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301351057 1 8738 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 7-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301351058 18717 OilWell Producino

C TRIBAL 8-220-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301 351 069 19233 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 9-17D.56 17 5 S 6 W 4301351070 18945 OilWell Producing
c TRTBAL 7-2745 27 4 S 5 W 4301 351073 18685 OilWell Producing
c TRTBAL 11-24-45 24 4 S 5 W 430135't076 18745 OilWell Producing

FEDERAL 3-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301 351093 18705 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 4-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301351094 18704 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 5-12D.65 12 6 S 5 W 4301 351 095 't8702 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 6-12D.65 12 6 S 5 W 4301351096 18703 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-5-54 5 5 S 4 W 43013s1111 18909 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 9.8D-56 8 5 S 6 W 4301351112 18522 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 4-9-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301351126 19059 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2-9.54 9 5 S 4 W 4301351 128 18946 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 'I-'IO-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301 3sl 1 29 18879 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 8.30D-56 30 5 S 6 W 4301 351 1 31 1 8539 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 1-1D-65 1 6 S 5 W 4301351142 18623 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8.9-54 o 5 S 4 W 4301351 143 18947 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 15-1D-65 1 o S 5 W 4301 3sl 1 7s 18654 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 16.1D.65 1 6 S 5 W 4301 351 1 76 18655 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-29D.56 29 5 S 6 W 4301 351 1 83 1 8873 OilWell Producino
STATE TRIBAL 8.12.55 12 5 S 5 W 4301351 188 18986 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 11-2OD-56 20 5 S 6 W 4301351189 18819 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 5-20D-56 20 5 S 6 W 4301351 190 18818 OilWell Producino
LC FEE 9-19-56 19 5 S 6 W 4301351 192 18596 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 9-9D-56 I 5 S 6 W 4301351 198 1 8595 OilWell Producing
OWL AND THE HAWK 3-9C5 I 3 S 5 W 430',t351214 18649 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 16.664 o o S 4 W 430',t351217 '18792 OilWell Producing
FEDEML 9€D-64 6 S 4 W 4301351218 18791 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 15-6D-64 o S W 4301351219 1 8793 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5.17-55 17 5 S 5 W 430135'.t220 18841 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-3-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301351226 18664 OilWell Producing
STATE TRIBAL 8-7-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301351228 18743 OilWell Producinq
STATE TRIBAL '12.1.55 1 5 S 5 W 4301351229 1874',1 OilWell Producinq
STATE TRIBAL '11.2-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301 351 230 18742 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 1-11.65 11 o S 5 W 4301351231 18689 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 8-11D-65 11 a! S 5 W 430135',t232 18688 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 2.11D-65 11 6 S 5 W 43013s1233 18690 OilWell Producing
STATE TRIBAL 12-3-55 3 5 S 5 W 4301 351 236 18744 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL .11-4.55 4 5 S 5 W 4301351237 18663 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 4-9-55 9 5 S 5 W 4301 351 238 18796 OilWell Producino

26 6114t2017

ellTransfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC
Nective:3/1/2017

LC TRIBAL9-15D-56 15 5 S 6 VV 4301351031 18441 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL 6-28-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301351034 18700 OilWell Producing
FEDEFLAL 1-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351055 18739 OilVVell Producirg¡
FEDERAL 8-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301351056 18718 OilWell Producing
FEDERygL2-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351057 18738 OilVVell Produciry¡
FEDERAL 7-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301351058 18717 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 8-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301351069 19233 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL9-170-56 17 5 S 6 VV 4301351070 18945 Oilmfell Producingi
LC TRIBAL 7-27-45 27 4 S 5 W 4301351073 18685 OilWell _ Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-24-45 24 4 S 5 W 4301351076 18745 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL3-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351093 18705 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDEFL4L4-120-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351094 18704 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFLAL5-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351095 18702 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFLAL6-120-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351096 18703 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-5-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301351111 18909 OilWell Producing
LCTTRIBAL9-8D-56 8 5 S 6 VV 4301351112 18522 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL4-9-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351126 19059 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAA.24)-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351128 18946 Oilwlell Producing
UTETRIBA1.1-10-5.4 10 5 S 4 VV 4301351129 18879 OilVVell Producing
LCTRIBAL8-30D-S6 30 5 S 6 VV 4301351131 18539 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDERAI.1-1D§5 1 6 S 5 VV 4301351142 18623 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAA.84)-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351143 18947 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 15-1D-65 1 6 S 5 W 4301351175 18654 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL16-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301351176 18655 Oil\¾ell Producing
LCTRIBAL11-29D-56 29 5 S 6 VV 4301351183 18873 Oil\¾ell Producing
STATE TRIBAL8-12-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301351188 18986 OilWell Producing
LC TTRIEL4L11-20D-56 20 5 S 6 VV 4301351189 18819 OilVVell Producirg¡
LCFEE5-20D-56 20 5 S 6 VV 4301351190 18818 OilVVell P·roducin9
LC FEE9-19-56 19 5 S 6 VV 4301351192 18596 OilVVell Producirg¡
LCTRIBAL9-9D-56 9 5 S 6 VV 4301351198 18595 Oil\Nell Producing
ÕVVLANDTHEHAVVK3-9C5 9 3 S 5 VV 4301351214 18649 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDEFLAL16-645.4 6 6 S 4 VV 4301351217 18792 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFLAL9-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301351218 18791 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 15-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301351219 18793 OilWell Producing
LTTETTRIELAL5-17-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301351220 18841 OilVVell Producirg)
UTETRIBAL 16-3-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301351226 18664 OilVVell Producing
STATE TRIBAL8-7-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301351228 18743 OilWell Pr
STATETRIBAL12-1-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301351229 18741 Oil\Nell Producing
STATE TRIBAL11-2-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301351230 18742 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 1-11-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301351231 18689 OilWell Producing
FEDERALB-11D-65 11 6 S 5 VV 4301351232 18688 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDERAL 2-11D-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301351233 18690 OilWell Producing
STATETRIBAL12-3-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301351236 18744 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAL11-4-55 4 5 S 5 VV 4301351237 18663 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAL.4-9-55 9 5 S 5 VV 4301351238 18796 OilVVell Producing
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ellTransfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC
Nective:3/1/2017

LC TRIBAL9-15D-56 15 5 S 6 VV 4301351031 18441 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL 6-28-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301351034 18700 OilWell Producing
FEDEFLAL 1-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351055 18739 OilVVell Producirg¡
FEDERAL 8-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301351056 18718 OilWell Producing
FEDERygL2-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351057 18738 OilVVell Produciry¡
FEDERAL 7-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301351058 18717 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 8-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301351069 19233 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL9-170-56 17 5 S 6 VV 4301351070 18945 Oilmfell Producingi
LC TRIBAL 7-27-45 27 4 S 5 W 4301351073 18685 OilWell _ Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-24-45 24 4 S 5 W 4301351076 18745 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL3-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351093 18705 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDEFL4L4-120-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351094 18704 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFLAL5-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351095 18702 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFLAL6-120-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351096 18703 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-5-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301351111 18909 OilWell Producing
LCTTRIBAL9-8D-56 8 5 S 6 VV 4301351112 18522 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL4-9-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351126 19059 Oil\Nell Producing
UTETRIBAA.24)-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351128 18946 Oilwlell Producing
UTETRIBA1.1-10-5.4 10 5 S 4 VV 4301351129 18879 OilVVell Producing
LCTRIBAL8-30D-S6 30 5 S 6 VV 4301351131 18539 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDERAI.1-1D§5 1 6 S 5 VV 4301351142 18623 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAA.84)-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351143 18947 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 15-1D-65 1 6 S 5 W 4301351175 18654 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL16-1D-65 1 6 S 5 VV 4301351176 18655 Oil\¾ell Producing
LCTRIBAL11-29D-56 29 5 S 6 VV 4301351183 18873 Oil\¾ell Producing
STATE TRIBAL8-12-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301351188 18986 OilWell Producing
LC TTRIEL4L11-20D-56 20 5 S 6 VV 4301351189 18819 OilVVell Producirg¡
LCFEE5-20D-56 20 5 S 6 VV 4301351190 18818 OilVVell P·roducin9
LC FEE9-19-56 19 5 S 6 VV 4301351192 18596 OilVVell Producirg¡
LCTRIBAL9-9D-56 9 5 S 6 VV 4301351198 18595 Oil\Nell Producing
ÕVVLANDTHEHAVVK3-9C5 9 3 S 5 VV 4301351214 18649 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDEFLAL16-645.4 6 6 S 4 VV 4301351217 18792 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFLAL9-6D-64 6 6 S 4 VV 4301351218 18791 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 15-6D-64 6 6 S 4 W 4301351219 18793 OilWell Producing
LTTETTRIELAL5-17-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301351220 18841 OilVVell Producirg)
UTETRIBAL 16-3-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301351226 18664 OilVVell Producing
STATE TRIBAL8-7-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301351228 18743 OilWell Pr
STATETRIBAL12-1-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301351229 18741 Oil\Nell Producing
STATE TRIBAL11-2-55 2 5 S 5 W 4301351230 18742 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 1-11-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301351231 18689 OilWell Producing
FEDERALB-11D-65 11 6 S 5 VV 4301351232 18688 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDERAL 2-11D-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301351233 18690 OilWell Producing
STATETRIBAL12-3-55 3 5 S 5 VV 4301351236 18744 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAL11-4-55 4 5 S 5 VV 4301351237 18663 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBAL.4-9-55 9 5 S 5 VV 4301351238 18796 OilVVell Producing

26



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC
Effective:

,TE TRIBAL 15-5.55 5 5 S 5 W 4301351239 18740 OilWell Producinq
,TE TRIBAL 9.21D.55 21 5 S 5 W 43013s1258 19401 OilWell Producinq
,TE FEE 9-9-54 I 5 S 4 W 4301351259 18642 OilWell Producing
c TRTBAL 4-2945 29 4 S 5 W 4301351260 18719 OilWell Producinq
,TE FEE 14.9D.54 9 5 S 4 W 4301351271 18684 OilWell Producinq
,TE FEE 15-9D-54 I 5 S 4 W 4301351272 18687 OilWell Producinq
c FEE 10-28D-56 28 5 S 6 W 4301 351288 18591 OilWell Producinq

JTE TRIBAL 8.16D-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301351295 1 9003 OilWell Producinq
=EE TRIBAL 4.5-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301 351 303 19187 OilWell Producinq
_c TRTBAL 1-26-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301351306 18816 OilWell Producinq
JTE TRIBAL 6-16D-54 16 5 S 4 W 4301351307 19060 OilWell Producinq
_c TRTBAL 7-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301 351 308 18795 OilWell Producino
_c TRTBAL 9-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301 351 309 18794 OilWell Producing
STATE TRIBAL 2.12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301 351 31 0 19444 OilWell Producino
_c TRTBAL 9-32D-56 32 5 S 6 W 4301 351 316 't9228 OilWell Producing
_c TRTBAL 7-26D-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301 351 31 I 188'.t7 OilWell Producino
_c FEE 8-6D-56 , 5 S 6 W 4301351342 18657 OilWell Producing
_c FEE 10-29D-45 29 4 S 5 W 4301351343 18850 OilWell Producino
-C TRIBAL 1-7D-56 7 5 S 6 W 4301351344 18774 OilWell Producinq
-C TRIBAL 9-7D-56 7 5 S 6 W 4301 351 346 18773 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 7JIOD-$4 10 5 S 4 W 4301351365 19391 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 11.10D.56 10 5 S o W 4301 351 369 18840 QLt_Wc1l

OilWell
Producinq

LC FEE 1-31D-45 31 4 S 5 W 4301351371 18686 Producino
LC TRIBAL 9-26D.56 26 5 S 6 W 4301 351 381 19433 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL '.t4-21D,-56 21 5 S 6 W 4301 351 384 18877 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 4-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301 351 385 18878 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 8.21D-56 21 5 S o W 4301 351 392 18874 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 'I-17-55 17 5 S 5 W 430135'1393 18848 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 4.33D45 33 4 S 5 W 4301 351 401 1 8853 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 16.21D-56 2',! 5 S o W 4301 351407 1887s OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 2.10D-54 10 5 S 4 W 430135141 1 19172 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 8-17D-55 17 5 S 5 W 4301 35141 3 1 9388 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 4.10D-54 10 5 S 4 W 43013s',t414 19069 OilWell Producino
LC TRTBAL 2-210-56 16 5 S o W 4301 35141 8 19252 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 1.23D.45 23 4 S 5 W 4301351425 18855 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 2-28D-45 28 4 S 5 W 430135',t429 18701 OilWell Producino
LC TRIBAL 9-28D-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301351430 18656 OilWell Producinq
LC FEE 1-1-56 1 5 S c W 43013514s8 18829 OilWell Producing
Binqham #3-4Bl 4 2 S 1 W 4301351464 18825 OilWell Producinq
LC Tribal 12-32-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301351465 18772 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 2-5-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301351520 18880 OilWell Producinq
LC Tribal 3-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301351561 't8842 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 5-15D-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301351562 19253 OilWell Producinq
LC FEE 16-36-56 36 5 S o W 430135161 1 19096 OilWell Producinq
LC FEE 10-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301351622 19583 OilWell Producino

27 6t14t2017

Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: LinnOperation, LLC

·ñective:3/1/2017

UTETRIBAL15-5-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301351239 18740 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBALEN21D-55 21 5 S 5 VV 4301351258 19401 Oil\Nell Producing
UTEFEE6N9-fk‡ 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351259 18642 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL4-2945 29 4 S 5 VV 4301351260 18719 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE FEE 14-90-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351271 18684 OilVVell Producing
UTEFEE15-9D-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351272 18687 Oil\¾ell Producing
LC FEE 10-28D-56 28 5 S 6 VV 4301351288 18591 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAJ.8-16D-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301351295 19003 OilVVell P'roducing
FEETRIBAL4-5-!¾‡ 5 5 S 4 VV 4301351303 19187 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTTRIBAL1-26-56 26 5 S 6 VV 4301351306 18816 OilVVell Producirm
UTETRIBAA.6-16D-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301351307 19060 OilVVell P'roducing
LCTRIBAJ.7-22D-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301351308 18795 OilVVell Producirm
LCTRIBAL9-22D-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301351309 18794 Oilmfell Producing
STATETRIBA1.2-12D-55 12 5 S 5 VV 4301351310 19444 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL9-32D-56 32 5 S 6 VV 4301351316 19228 OilVVell Producir¼¡
LC TRIBAL7-26D-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301351319 18817 OilWell Producing
LCFEEB-6D-56 6 5 S 6 VV 4301351342 18657 Oil\Nell Producing
LC FEE 10-29D-45 29 4 S 5 W 4301351343 18850 OilWell
LCTRIBAI.1-7D-56 7 5 S 6 VV 4301351344 18774 OilVVell Producing
LC TTilBAL9-7D-56 7 5 S 6 VV 4301351346 18773 OilVVell Produciry)
UTETRIBAA.7-10D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301351365 19391 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-10D-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301351369 18840 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 1-31D45 31 4 S 5 VV 4301351371 18686 Oil\¾ell Producing
LCTRIBAL 9-26D-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301351381 19433 OilWell Produc
LCTRIBAL14-21D-56 21 5 S 6 W 4301351384 18877 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL4-22D-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301351385 18878 Oil\Nell Producin9LCTRIBAd.8-21D-56 21 5 S 6 VV 4301351392 18874 OilVVell Producing
llTETRIBAA.1-17-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301351393 18848 OilVVell P'roduciry)
LCTRIBAL4-33D45 33 4 S 5 VV 4301351401 18853 Oil\Nell Producing
LC TRIBAL 16-21D-56 21 5 S 6 W 4301351407 18875 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-10D-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301351411 19172 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBALB-170-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301351413 19388 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL4-100-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301351414 19069 Oilm/ell Producing
LCTRIBAL2-21D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301351418 19252 OilVVell Producing
LC 1TRIELAL1-23D-45 23 4 S 5 VV 4301351425 18855 OilVVell Producirg)
LCTRIB/4.2:-28D-45 28 4 S 5 VV 4301351429 18701 OilVVell Producirx;
LC TTilELAL9-28D-45 28 4 S 5 VV 4301351430 18656 OilVVell Producirx;
LC FEE 1-1-56 1 5 S 6 VV 4301351458 18829 OilVVell Producirm
Bingham#3-4B1 4 2 S 1 VV 4301351464 18825 OilVVell Producing
LCTribal12-32-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301351465 18772 Oilvvell Producing
UTETTRIBAL2-5-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301351520 18880 OilVVell Producing
LCTribal3-32D-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301351561 18842 OilVVell Producing
LCTTRIBAL5-15D-56 15 5 S 6 VV 4301351562 19253 OilVVell Producing
LC FEE 16-36-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301351611 19096 Oil\¾ell Producing
LC:FEE 10-36D-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301351622|19583 OilVVell Producing
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Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: LinnOperation, LLC

·ñective:3/1/2017

UTETRIBAL15-5-55 5 5 S 5 VV 4301351239 18740 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETRIBALEN21D-55 21 5 S 5 VV 4301351258 19401 Oil\Nell Producing
UTEFEE6N9-fk‡ 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351259 18642 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL4-2945 29 4 S 5 VV 4301351260 18719 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTE FEE 14-90-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351271 18684 OilVVell Producing
UTEFEE15-9D-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351272 18687 Oil\¾ell Producing
LC FEE 10-28D-56 28 5 S 6 VV 4301351288 18591 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAJ.8-16D-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301351295 19003 OilVVell P'roducing
FEETRIBAL4-5-!¾‡ 5 5 S 4 VV 4301351303 19187 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTTRIBAL1-26-56 26 5 S 6 VV 4301351306 18816 OilVVell Producirm
UTETRIBAA.6-16D-54 16 5 S 4 VV 4301351307 19060 OilVVell P'roducing
LCTRIBAJ.7-22D-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301351308 18795 OilVVell Producirm
LCTRIBAL9-22D-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301351309 18794 Oilmfell Producing
STATETRIBA1.2-12D-55 12 5 S 5 VV 4301351310 19444 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL9-32D-56 32 5 S 6 VV 4301351316 19228 OilVVell Producir¼¡
LC TRIBAL7-26D-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301351319 18817 OilWell Producing
LCFEEB-6D-56 6 5 S 6 VV 4301351342 18657 Oil\Nell Producing
LC FEE 10-29D-45 29 4 S 5 W 4301351343 18850 OilWell
LCTRIBAI.1-7D-56 7 5 S 6 VV 4301351344 18774 OilVVell Producing
LC TTilBAL9-7D-56 7 5 S 6 VV 4301351346 18773 OilVVell Produciry)
UTETRIBAA.7-10D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301351365 19391 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-10D-56 10 5 S 6 W 4301351369 18840 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 1-31D45 31 4 S 5 VV 4301351371 18686 Oil\¾ell Producing
LCTRIBAL 9-26D-56 26 5 S 6 W 4301351381 19433 OilWell Produc
LCTRIBAL14-21D-56 21 5 S 6 W 4301351384 18877 OilWell Producing
LCTRIBAL4-22D-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301351385 18878 Oil\Nell Producin9LCTRIBAd.8-21D-56 21 5 S 6 VV 4301351392 18874 OilVVell Producing
llTETRIBAA.1-17-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301351393 18848 OilVVell P'roduciry)
LCTRIBAL4-33D45 33 4 S 5 VV 4301351401 18853 Oil\Nell Producing
LC TRIBAL 16-21D-56 21 5 S 6 W 4301351407 18875 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-10D-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301351411 19172 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBALB-170-55 17 5 S 5 VV 4301351413 19388 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL4-100-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301351414 19069 Oilm/ell Producing
LCTRIBAL2-21D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301351418 19252 OilVVell Producing
LC 1TRIELAL1-23D-45 23 4 S 5 VV 4301351425 18855 OilVVell Producirg)
LCTRIB/4.2:-28D-45 28 4 S 5 VV 4301351429 18701 OilVVell Producirx;
LC TTilELAL9-28D-45 28 4 S 5 VV 4301351430 18656 OilVVell Producirx;
LC FEE 1-1-56 1 5 S 6 VV 4301351458 18829 OilVVell Producirm
Bingham#3-4B1 4 2 S 1 VV 4301351464 18825 OilVVell Producing
LCTribal12-32-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301351465 18772 Oilvvell Producing
UTETTRIBAL2-5-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301351520 18880 OilVVell Producing
LCTribal3-32D-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301351561 18842 OilVVell Producing
LCTTRIBAL5-15D-56 15 5 S 6 VV 4301351562 19253 OilVVell Producing
LC FEE 16-36-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301351611 19096 Oil\¾ell Producing
LC:FEE 10-36D-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301351622|19583 OilVVell Producing

27



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

3t
RED MOUNTAIN 3-581 5 2 S ,l W 4301351632 1 89s4 OilWell Producinq
LC TRTBAL 15-34-56 34 5 S o W 4301351647 18962 OilWell Producinq
LC TRTBAL 15-27-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301351649 19605 OilWell Producinq
LC TRTBAL 11-270-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301351650 19606 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 1.34D-56 34 5 S 6 W 4301351660 18988 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 2.29D45 29 4 S 5 W 4301 351 705 19545 OilWell Producinq
LC FEE 13-23-56 23 5 S 6 W 4301351706 18994 OilWell Producinq
LC FEE 11-23D-56 23 5 S 6 W 4301351707 18995 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 3-33.56 33 5 S 6 W 430',t351711 19242 OilWell Producino
LC FEE 11-29D-45 29 4 S 5 W 4301351743 19188 OilWell Producinq
LC TAYLOR FEE 14.220.56 22 5 S o W 4301351744 1 9508 OilWell Producino
LC FEE 4-28D45 29 4 S 5 W 4301351745 18849 OilWell
LC FEE 14-6D-56 6 5 S 6 W 4301351787 18910 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 15-6-56 6 5 S 6 W 430',t351792 1 9334 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 9-27.56 27 5 S 6 W 4301351822 19607 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 7-27D.56 27 5 S 6 W 4301 351823 19608 OilWell Producing
MECHAM #3.18.2 1 2 S 2 W 4301351844 19082 OilWell Producing
MIKE AND SHELLEY #3.48.2 4 2 s 2 W 430135't845 19083 OilWell
C Fee 14-36D-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301 351 878 't9376 OilWell

LC Fee 12-36-56 36 5 S 6 W 4301 351 883 19377 OilWell Producing
LC Tribal6-29D-45 29 4 S 5 W 4301 351 902 19402 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 6-7-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301 351 91 5 19117 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 3-7D.64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351916 191 15 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 4-7D.64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351917 191 10 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 5.7D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351918 19111 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 2.7-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351919 19139 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 1-7D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351920 19140 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 12-7D.64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351924 19025 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 11.7D.64 7 o S 4 W 4301351925 19039 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 13-7D-64 7 o S 4 W 4301351926 19026 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL '14-7D.64 7 6 S 4 W 430',t351927 19040 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 7.70-64 7 o s 4 W 4301 351 933 1914',|/ OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 8-7D.64 7 o S 4 W 4301351934 19142 OilWell Producino
FEDERAL 9.7D-64 7 o S 4 W 430135'1935 19143 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 10.7D.6,4 7 6 S 4 W 4301351936 19144 OilWell Producing
ABBOTT FEE 6-6.54 o 5 S 4 W 4301351948 1 8963 OilWell Producing
ABBOTT FEE 2-6D.54 b 5 S 4 W 4301351949 18974 OilWell Producing
ABBOTT FEE 4.6.54 6 5 s 4 W 4301351952 1 8965 OilWell Producing
FederalT-gD-64 9 o s 4 W 4301351990 19721 OilWell Producing
Federal 15-12D-65 12 Et S 5 W 4301351992 19051 OilWell Producino
Federal 10-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301351999 19052 OilWell Producing
Federal 9-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301 352000 1 9053 OilWell Producino

ederal 16-12D-65 12 o S 5 W 4301 352003 19054 OilWell Producing
ederal4-6D-65 o 6 S 5 W 4301 352005 19173 OilWell Producing
ederal 12-6D-65 b 6 D 5 W 4301352006 19',174 OilWell Producino

28 6t14t2017

Well Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
¯o: Linn Operation, LLC
Ëffective:3/1/2017
REDWK)UNTAIN3-5B1 5 2 S 1 VV 4301351632 18954 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL15-34-56 34 5 S 6 VV 4301351647 18962 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIllAL15-27-56 27 5 S 6 VV 4301351649 19605 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTTRIBAL11-27D-56 27 5 S 6 VV 4301351650 19606 OilVVell Producirm
LCTRIllAL1-34D-56 34 5 S 6 VV 4301351660 18988 Clil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL2-29D-45 29 4 S 5 VV 4301351705 19545 Oil\Nell Producing
LC FEE 13-23-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301351706 18994 Oil\Nell Producing
LC FEE 11-23D-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301351707 18995 OilVVell Producing
LCTRIBAL3-33-56 33 5 S 6 VV 4301351711 19242 Oil\Nell Producing
LCFEE 11-29D-45 29 4 S 5 VV 4301351743 19188 OilVVell Producirm
LC TAYLORFEE 14-;220-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301351744 19508 OilVVell Producing
LC FEE4-28D-45 29 4 S 5 VV 4301351745 18849 OilVVell P'roducing
LC FEE 14-SD-56 6 5 S 6 VV 4301351787 18910 OilVVell Producingi
LCFEE15-6-56 6 5 S 6 VV 4301351792 19314 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL9-27-56 27 5 S 6 VV 4301351822 19607 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL7-27D-56 27 5 S 6 VV 4301351823 19608 Oil\Nell Producing
MECHAJA#3-1B2 1 2 S 2 VV 4301351844 19082 OilVVell Producing
MIKEAND SHELLEY #3-4B2 4 2 S 2 W 4301351845 19083 OilWell Producing
LC Fee 14-360-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301351878 19376 OilVVell Producing
LC:Fee 12636-56 _ 36 5 S 6 VV 4301351883 19377 OilVVell Producing
LCTdbal6-:29D-45 29 4 S 5 VV 4301351902 19402 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFLAL6-7-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351915 19117 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL3-7D-6.4 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351916 19115 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDERAL4-7D-6.4 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351917 19110 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDERAL 5-7D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351918 19111 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL2-7-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351919 19139 OilWell Producing
FEDEFLAL1-7D-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351920 19140 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFL4L 12-7D-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351924 19025 OilVVell Producing
ÍËIDERAL11-7D-6.4 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351925 19039 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDERAL13-7D-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351926 19026 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDEFLAL 14-7D-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351927 19040 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 7-7D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351933 19141 OilWell Producing
FEDEFLAL8-7D-64 7 6 S 4 \N 4301351934 19142 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 9-7D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351935 19143 OilWell Producing
FEDEFLAL10-7D-64 7 6 S 4 \N 4301351936 19144 OilVVell Producirm
AgBOTTFEE6-6-5·4 6 5 S 4 VV 4301351948 18963 Oil\Nell Producing
ABBOTTFEE 2-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301351949 18974 OilWell Producing
ABBOTTFEE 4-6-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301351952 18965 OilWell Producing
Federal7-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301351990 19721 OilVVell Produciry
Fedenal15-12D-65 12 6 S 5 \N 4301351992 19051 OilVVell PToducirm
Fedenal10-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351999 19052 Oil\Nell Producing
Federal9-12D-65 12 6 S 5 \N 4301352000 19053 OilVVell PToducing
Federal 16-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301352003 19054 OilWell Producing
Federal4-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352005 19173 OilVVell PToducirm
Fedenal12-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352006 19174 OilVVell Producing

28

Well Transfer
¯rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
¯o: Linn Operation, LLC
Ëffective:3/1/2017
REDWK)UNTAIN3-5B1 5 2 S 1 VV 4301351632 18954 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL15-34-56 34 5 S 6 VV 4301351647 18962 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIllAL15-27-56 27 5 S 6 VV 4301351649 19605 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTTRIBAL11-27D-56 27 5 S 6 VV 4301351650 19606 OilVVell Producirm
LCTRIllAL1-34D-56 34 5 S 6 VV 4301351660 18988 Clil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL2-29D-45 29 4 S 5 VV 4301351705 19545 Oil\Nell Producing
LC FEE 13-23-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301351706 18994 Oil\Nell Producing
LC FEE 11-23D-56 23 5 S 6 VV 4301351707 18995 OilVVell Producing
LCTRIBAL3-33-56 33 5 S 6 VV 4301351711 19242 Oil\Nell Producing
LCFEE 11-29D-45 29 4 S 5 VV 4301351743 19188 OilVVell Producirm
LC TAYLORFEE 14-;220-56 22 5 S 6 VV 4301351744 19508 OilVVell Producing
LC FEE4-28D-45 29 4 S 5 VV 4301351745 18849 OilVVell P'roducing
LC FEE 14-SD-56 6 5 S 6 VV 4301351787 18910 OilVVell Producingi
LCFEE15-6-56 6 5 S 6 VV 4301351792 19314 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL9-27-56 27 5 S 6 VV 4301351822 19607 Oil\Nell Producing
LCTRIBAL7-27D-56 27 5 S 6 VV 4301351823 19608 Oil\Nell Producing
MECHAJA#3-1B2 1 2 S 2 VV 4301351844 19082 OilVVell Producing
MIKEAND SHELLEY #3-4B2 4 2 S 2 W 4301351845 19083 OilWell Producing
LC Fee 14-360-56 36 5 S 6 VV 4301351878 19376 OilVVell Producing
LC:Fee 12636-56 _ 36 5 S 6 VV 4301351883 19377 OilVVell Producing
LCTdbal6-:29D-45 29 4 S 5 VV 4301351902 19402 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFLAL6-7-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351915 19117 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL3-7D-6.4 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351916 19115 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDERAL4-7D-6.4 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351917 19110 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDERAL 5-7D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351918 19111 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL2-7-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351919 19139 OilWell Producing
FEDEFLAL1-7D-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351920 19140 OilVVell Producing
FEDEFL4L 12-7D-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351924 19025 OilVVell Producing
ÍËIDERAL11-7D-6.4 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351925 19039 Oil\Nell Producing
FEDERAL13-7D-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351926 19026 Oil\¾ell Producing
FEDEFLAL 14-7D-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301351927 19040 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 7-7D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351933 19141 OilWell Producing
FEDEFLAL8-7D-64 7 6 S 4 \N 4301351934 19142 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 9-7D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301351935 19143 OilWell Producing
FEDEFLAL10-7D-64 7 6 S 4 \N 4301351936 19144 OilVVell Producirm
AgBOTTFEE6-6-5·4 6 5 S 4 VV 4301351948 18963 Oil\Nell Producing
ABBOTTFEE 2-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301351949 18974 OilWell Producing
ABBOTTFEE 4-6-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301351952 18965 OilWell Producing
Federal7-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301351990 19721 OilVVell Produciry
Fedenal15-12D-65 12 6 S 5 \N 4301351992 19051 OilVVell PToducirm
Fedenal10-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301351999 19052 Oil\Nell Producing
Federal9-12D-65 12 6 S 5 \N 4301352000 19053 OilVVell PToducing
Federal 16-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301352003 19054 OilWell Producing
Federal4-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352005 19173 OilVVell PToducirm
Fedenal12-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352006 19174 OilVVell Producing

28



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

Federal 1-6D-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301352012 19189 OilWell Producing
Federal3-6D-65 6 6 S 5 W 43013s2014 19190 OilWell Producing
Federal3-9D-64 9 6 S 4 W 4301352015 19678 OilWell Producino
Federal2-6-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301352017 19191 OilWell Producino
FederalT-6D-65 o 6 S 5 W 4301352018 't9192 OilWell Producino
Federal 6-9-64 9 6 S 4 W 430',t35202',1 19679 OilWell Producing
Federal 8-9D-64 9 6 S 4 W 4301 352023 19723 OilWell Producino
Federal 5-9D-64 9 6 S 4 W 4301352035 19680 OilWell Producino
Federal 11-9D-64 9 6 S 4 W 4301352037 19687 OilWell Producinq
Federal 12-9D-64 o 6 S 4 W 4301352038 19688 OilWell Producino
Federal 13-9D-64 I o S 4 W 4301 352039 19689 OilWell Producinq
Federal2-9D€4 9 6 S 4 W 4301352042 '19724 OilWell Producino
Federal 16-11D-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301352045 1 9070 OilWell Producinq
Federal 15-11D-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301352046 19076 OilWell Producino
Federal 10-11D-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301352047 19077 OilWell Producinq
Federal 9-1 1D-65 11 6 S 5 W 4301352048 't9071 OilWell Producino
Federal 11-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301352049 '19121 OilWell Producino
Federal 12-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301352050 19122 OilWell Producinq
Federal 13-12D-65 12 E S 5 W 430',t352052 19123 OilWell Producinq
Federal 14-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301352053 19124 OilWell Producinq
LC Tribal 12-28D-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301352089 19378 OilWell Producing
LC Tribal 2-32D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301352113 19348 OilWell Producino
LC Tribal 16-29D-45 32 4 S 5 W 4301352114 19349 OilWell Producinq
Vieira Tribal3-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352145 19210 OilWell Producino
Vieira Tribal5-4D-54 4 5 D 4 W 4301352146 19193 OilWell Producinq
Vieira Tribal6-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352',t47 19216 OilWell Producino
lamplugh Tribal 6-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352148 19289 OilWell Producinq
lampluqh Tribal 5-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352149 19290 Gas Well

ilugh Tribal4-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352150 't9291 OilWell Producinq
rlugh Tribal 3-3D-51! 3 5 S 4 W 4301 3521 51 't9292 OilWell Producino
Tribal6-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301 3521 58 19254 Gas Well Producing
Tribal4-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301 3521 59 19255 Gas Well Producinq

iner Tribal 3-1 1D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301 352165 19194 OilWell Producing
iner Tribal 4-1'l-54 't'l 5 S 4 W 4301352166 1919s OilWell Producinq
iner Tribal 5-11D-54 't1 5 S 4 W 4301352167 19196 OilWell Producinq
nolly Tribal 1-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301 3521 68 19270 OilWell Producino
nollv Tribal 2-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352169 19',t97 OilWell

3onolly Tribal 7-1 1 D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352',t70 19280 OilWell
lonollv Tribal 8-1 1 D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352171 19281 OilWell
Qaqpet lrQql 1:5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352180 19198 OilWell
Fee Tribal 6-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352181 19199 OilWell
Fee Tribal 5-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352'.t82 19200 OilWell
Fee Tribal 3-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352184 1920',1 OilWell
qcqpqrlrlb_alz:ED-81 5 5 S 4 W 4301352185 19202 OilWell
UTE Tribal 10-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352198 19320 OilWell Producino

29 6114t2017

Well Transfer
From: LinnOperating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

¯ffective: 3/1/2017
Federal1-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352012 19189 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal3-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352014 19190 OilVVell P'roducing
Federal3-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352015 19678 Oil\¾ell Producing
Federal2-IS-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352017 19191 Oil\¾ell Producing
Fedenal7-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352018 19192 OilVVell PToducin 9Fedenal6-9-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352021 19679 OilVVell Producirš¡
Federal8-9D-6.4 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352023 19723 Oil\Nell Producing
Federal5-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352035 19680 OilVVell Producing
Federal11-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352037 19687 OilVVell Producing
Federal12-90-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352038 19688 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal13-9D-6.4 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352039 19689 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal2-90-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352042 19724 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal16-11D-65 11 6 S 5 \N 4301352045 19070 OilVVell Producirg¡
Fedenal15-11D-65 11 6 S 5 VV 4301352046 19076 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal10-11D-65 11 6 S 5 VV 4301352047 19077 OilVVell Producing
Fedena19-11D-65 11 6 S 5 VV 4301352048 19071 OilVVell Producirmi
Fedenal11-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301352049 19121 OilVVell P'roducing
Federal 12-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301352050 19122 OilWell Producing
Fedenal13-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301352052 19123 OilVVell PToducin
Fedenal14-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301352053 19124 OilVVell PToducirti
LC Tribal 12-28D-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301352089 19378 OilWell Producing
LCTribal2-32D-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301352113 19348 OilVVell P•roducirmi
LCTribal16-29D-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301352114 19349 OilVVell P'roducin9
Vieira Tribal 3-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352145 19210 OilWell Producing
Vieira Tribal 5-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352146 19193 OilWell Producing
Vieira Tribal 6-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352147 19216 OilWell Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 6-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352148 19289 OilWell Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 5-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352149 19290 Gas Well Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 4-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352150 19291 OilWell Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 3-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352151 19292 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 6-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352158 19254 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 4-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352159 19255 Gas Well Producing
EksinerTribal3-11D-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352165 19194 OilVVell Producing
Heiner Tribal 4-11-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352166 19195 OilWell Producing
ÑeinerTribal 5-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352167 19196 OilWell Producing
ConollyTdbal1-11D-54 11 5 S 4 \N 4301352168 19270 OilVVell Producing
ConollyTribal2-11D-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352169 19197 OilVVell Producing
ConollyTribal7-11D-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352170 19280 Oilm/ell Producing
ConollyTribal8-11D-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352171 19281 Oil\¾ell Producing
CasperTribal1-5D-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352180 19198 OilVVell Producing
Fee Tribal 6-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352181 19199 OilWell Producing
Fee Tribal 5-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352182 19200 OilWell Producing
Fee Tribal 3-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352184 19201 OilWell Producing
Casper Tribal 7-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352185 19202 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 10-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352198 19320 OilWell |Producing

29

Well Transfer
From: LinnOperating, Inc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

¯ffective: 3/1/2017
Federal1-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352012 19189 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal3-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352014 19190 OilVVell P'roducing
Federal3-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352015 19678 Oil\¾ell Producing
Federal2-IS-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352017 19191 Oil\¾ell Producing
Fedenal7-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352018 19192 OilVVell PToducin 9Fedenal6-9-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352021 19679 OilVVell Producirš¡
Federal8-9D-6.4 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352023 19723 Oil\Nell Producing
Federal5-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352035 19680 OilVVell Producing
Federal11-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352037 19687 OilVVell Producing
Federal12-90-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352038 19688 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal13-9D-6.4 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352039 19689 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal2-90-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352042 19724 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal16-11D-65 11 6 S 5 \N 4301352045 19070 OilVVell Producirg¡
Fedenal15-11D-65 11 6 S 5 VV 4301352046 19076 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal10-11D-65 11 6 S 5 VV 4301352047 19077 OilVVell Producing
Fedena19-11D-65 11 6 S 5 VV 4301352048 19071 OilVVell Producirmi
Fedenal11-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301352049 19121 OilVVell P'roducing
Federal 12-12D-65 12 6 S 5 W 4301352050 19122 OilWell Producing
Fedenal13-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301352052 19123 OilVVell PToducin
Fedenal14-12D-65 12 6 S 5 VV 4301352053 19124 OilVVell PToducirti
LC Tribal 12-28D-45 28 4 S 5 W 4301352089 19378 OilWell Producing
LCTribal2-32D-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301352113 19348 OilVVell P•roducirmi
LCTribal16-29D-45 32 4 S 5 VV 4301352114 19349 OilVVell P'roducin9
Vieira Tribal 3-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352145 19210 OilWell Producing
Vieira Tribal 5-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352146 19193 OilWell Producing
Vieira Tribal 6-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352147 19216 OilWell Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 6-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352148 19289 OilWell Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 5-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352149 19290 Gas Well Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 4-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352150 19291 OilWell Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 3-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352151 19292 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 6-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352158 19254 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 4-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352159 19255 Gas Well Producing
EksinerTribal3-11D-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352165 19194 OilVVell Producing
Heiner Tribal 4-11-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352166 19195 OilWell Producing
ÑeinerTribal 5-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352167 19196 OilWell Producing
ConollyTdbal1-11D-54 11 5 S 4 \N 4301352168 19270 OilVVell Producing
ConollyTribal2-11D-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352169 19197 OilVVell Producing
ConollyTribal7-11D-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352170 19280 Oilm/ell Producing
ConollyTribal8-11D-54 11 5 S 4 VV 4301352171 19281 Oil\¾ell Producing
CasperTribal1-5D-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352180 19198 OilVVell Producing
Fee Tribal 6-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352181 19199 OilWell Producing
Fee Tribal 5-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352182 19200 OilWell Producing
Fee Tribal 3-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352184 19201 OilWell Producing
Casper Tribal 7-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352185 19202 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 10-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352198 19320 OilWell |Producing

29



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

UTE Tribal 14-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352199 1931 1 Gas Well Producinq
UTE Tribal '12-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352200 19312 OilWell Producinq
UTE Tribal 14-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352213 19509 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 16-35D-54 35 5 D 4 W 4301352230 19321 OilWell Producino
Evans Tribal 1-3-54 3 5 S 4 W 430'.t352234 19264 OilWell Producinq
Evans Tribal 2-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 430',t352235 19265 OilWell Producinq
Evans Tribal 7-30-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352236 19256 OilWell Producinq
Evans Tribal 8-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352237 't9257 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal9-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352249 19236 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 15-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301 352250 19237 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 10-3-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352251 19238 OilWell Producino
Ute Tribal 14-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352298 19258 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 12-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301 352299 19259 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 11-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301 352300 19260 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 16.4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301 352302 19350 OilWell Producino
Ute Tribal 15-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301 352303 19293 )ilWell Producing
Ute Tribal9-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301 352305 19304 )ilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 10-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352307 't9294 OilWell Producinq
UTE Tribal 15-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301 352309 19472 Gas Well Producino
UTE Tribal 16-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352318 19473 Gas Well Producinq
UTE Tribal 2-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301 35231 9 't9322 OilWell Producino
UTE Tribal 8-35D-54 35 5 S

S
4 W 4301352320 1 9323 OilWell Producinq

Abbott Fee 5-6D-54 6 5 4 W 4301352326 1 9351 OilWell Producino
Ute Tribal 6-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352330 19243 OilWell Producinq
Ute Tribal 12-11D-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301 352331 19244 OilWell Producino
Ute Tribal 14-'l1O-54 11 5 S 4 W 4301352332 19245 OilWetl Producino
Ute Tribal 114D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301 352343 1 9305 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 13-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301 352345 1 9353 OilWell Producino
Ute Tribal '14-4D,-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301 352346 19306 OilWell Producing
State TribalT-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 430't352369 19651 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 1-'l2D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301 352390 't9445 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 16-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301 352394 19424 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 9-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301 352396 19426 OilWell Producing
State TribalT-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352426 19496 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 1-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352427 19497 OilWell Producino
State Tribal 2-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352428 19498 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 3-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352429 19517 OilWell Producinq
State Tribal 4-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352431 19546 OilWell Producinq
State Tribal 5-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352432 't9547 OilWell Producinq
State Tribal 6-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352433 19518 OilWell Producinq
State Tribal 11-6D-54 o 5 S 4 W 430',t352452 19474 OilWell Producino
State Tribal 12-OD-54 o 5 S 4 W 4301352453 19475 OilWell Producinq
State Tribal 13-6D-54 o 5 S 4 W 4301352454 19476 OilWell Producinq
Ute Tribal 1-9D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352465 19356 OilWell Producinq
Ute Tribal 7-gD-54 I 5 S 4 W 4301352466 19357 Oil Wall Producinq

30 6t1412017

Nell Transfer
2rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC

·ñective:3/1/2017

UTE Tribal 14-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352199 19311 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 12-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352200 19312 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 14-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352213 19509 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 16-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352230 19321 OilWell Producing
EvansTribal1-3-5at 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352234 19264 Oil\Nell Producing
Evans Tribal 2-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352235 19265 OilWell Producing
EvansTribal7-3D-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352236 19256 OilVVell Producing
EvansTiibal8-3D-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352237 19257 OilVVell Producing
UteTübal9-3D-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352249 19236 OilVVell Producing
UteTdbal15-3D-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352250 19237 OilVVell Producing
UteTdbal10-3-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352251 19238 Oil\Nell Producing
Ute Tribal 14-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352298 19258 OilWell Producing
UteTübal12-3D-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352299 19259 OilVVell Producing
ÜIteTubal11-3D-54 3 5

. S 4 VV 4301352300 19260 OilVVell Producing
UteTribal16-4D-54 4 5 S 4 VV 4301352302 19350 OilVVell Producing
Ute Tribal 15-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352303 19293 OilWell Producing
UteTribal9-4D-54 4 5 S 4 VV 4301352305 19304 Oil\¾ell Producing
Ute Tribal 10-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352307 19294 OilWell
UTETribal15-31D-55 31 5 S 5 \N 4301352309 19472 GhisVVell Producing
UTE Tribal 16-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352318 19473 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 2-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352319 19322 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 8-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352320 19323 OilWell Producing
Abbott Fee 5-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352326 19351 OilWell Producing
UteTribal6-110-54 11 5 S 4 \N 4301352330 19243 OilVVell Producing
UteTribal12-11D-54 11 5 S at VV 4301352331 19244 OilVVell Produchg
Ute Tribal 14-11D-54 11 5 S 4 __ W 4301352332 19245 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 11-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352343 19305 OilWell Producing
UteTiibal13-4D-54 4 5 S 4 VV 4301352345 19353 OilVVell Producing
UteTribal14-4D-54 4 5 S 4 VV 4301352346 19306 OilVVell Producing
State Tribal 7-12D-55 12 5 S 5 _ W 4301352369 19651 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 1-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352390 19445 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 16-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352394 19424 OilWell Producing
StateTribal9-6D-54 6 5 S 4 VV 4301352396 19426 OilVVell Producing
State Tribal 7-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352426 19496 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 1-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352427 19497 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 2-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352428 19498 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 3-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352429 19517 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 4-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352431 19546 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 5-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352432 19547 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 6-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352433 19518 OilWell
State Tribal 11-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352452 19474 OilWell Producin9StateTribal12-6D-54 6 5 S 4 VV 4301352453 19475 OilVVell Producing
State Tribal 13-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352454 19476 OilWell Producing
UteTribal1-9D-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301352465 19356 Oil\Nell Producing
Ute Tribal 7-9D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352466 19357 OilWell Producing

30

Nell Transfer
2rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
fo: Linn Operation, LLC

·ñective:3/1/2017

UTE Tribal 14-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352199 19311 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 12-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352200 19312 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 14-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352213 19509 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 16-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352230 19321 OilWell Producing
EvansTribal1-3-5at 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352234 19264 Oil\Nell Producing
Evans Tribal 2-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352235 19265 OilWell Producing
EvansTribal7-3D-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352236 19256 OilVVell Producing
EvansTiibal8-3D-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352237 19257 OilVVell Producing
UteTübal9-3D-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352249 19236 OilVVell Producing
UteTdbal15-3D-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352250 19237 OilVVell Producing
UteTdbal10-3-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352251 19238 Oil\Nell Producing
Ute Tribal 14-3D-54 3 5 S 4 W 4301352298 19258 OilWell Producing
UteTübal12-3D-54 3 5 S 4 VV 4301352299 19259 OilVVell Producing
ÜIteTubal11-3D-54 3 5

. S 4 VV 4301352300 19260 OilVVell Producing
UteTribal16-4D-54 4 5 S 4 VV 4301352302 19350 OilVVell Producing
Ute Tribal 15-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352303 19293 OilWell Producing
UteTribal9-4D-54 4 5 S 4 VV 4301352305 19304 Oil\¾ell Producing
Ute Tribal 10-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352307 19294 OilWell
UTETribal15-31D-55 31 5 S 5 \N 4301352309 19472 GhisVVell Producing
UTE Tribal 16-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352318 19473 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 2-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352319 19322 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 8-35D-54 35 5 S 4 W 4301352320 19323 OilWell Producing
Abbott Fee 5-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352326 19351 OilWell Producing
UteTribal6-110-54 11 5 S 4 \N 4301352330 19243 OilVVell Producing
UteTribal12-11D-54 11 5 S at VV 4301352331 19244 OilVVell Produchg
Ute Tribal 14-11D-54 11 5 S 4 __ W 4301352332 19245 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 11-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352343 19305 OilWell Producing
UteTiibal13-4D-54 4 5 S 4 VV 4301352345 19353 OilVVell Producing
UteTribal14-4D-54 4 5 S 4 VV 4301352346 19306 OilVVell Producing
State Tribal 7-12D-55 12 5 S 5 _ W 4301352369 19651 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 1-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352390 19445 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 16-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352394 19424 OilWell Producing
StateTribal9-6D-54 6 5 S 4 VV 4301352396 19426 OilVVell Producing
State Tribal 7-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352426 19496 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 1-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352427 19497 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 2-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352428 19498 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 3-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352429 19517 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 4-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352431 19546 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 5-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352432 19547 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 6-7D-54 7 5 S 4 W 4301352433 19518 OilWell
State Tribal 11-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352452 19474 OilWell Producin9StateTribal12-6D-54 6 5 S 4 VV 4301352453 19475 OilVVell Producing
State Tribal 13-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352454 19476 OilWell Producing
UteTribal1-9D-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301352465 19356 Oil\Nell Producing
Ute Tribal 7-9D-54 9 5 S 4 W 4301352466 19357 OilWell Producing

30



WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

UTE TRIBAL 12-5D.54 5 5 S 4 W 4301 352480 19499 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D.54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352484 19s00 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301 352493 19510 OilWell Producinq
Federal 14-6D-65 6 o S 5 W 4301 352495 19610 OilWell Producing
Federal 13-6D-65 o o S 5 W 4301 352496 1961 1 OilWell Producing
Federal 11-6D-65 o 6 S 5 W 4301352497 1 9591 OilWell Producino
Ute Tribal 16-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301 352545 1 9335 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 15-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352546 19358 OilWell Producinq
Ute Tribal 10-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352547 't9359 OilWell
Ute Tribal 8-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352548 19336 OilWell
State Tribal 13-11D-54 10 5 S 4 W 4301352561 19519 OilWell
State Tribal 1-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352568 19434 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 2-180-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352576 19427 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 8-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352577 '19428 OilWell Producinq
Federal 16-6D-65 o 6 S 5 W 4301 352590 19616 OilWell Producinq
Federal 15-6D-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301 352591 19617 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 4-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352607 19435 OilWell Producinq
State Tribal 3-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352608 19436 OilWell Producing
State Tribal6-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352609 19437 OilWell Producinq
State Tribal 5-'12-55 't2 5 S 5 W 4301352643 19446 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 12-'l2D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352644 19447 OilWell Producinq
State Tribal6-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352645 19438 OilWell Producino
State Tribal 16-1D-55 1 5 S 5 W 4301352646 19483 OilWell Producino
State Tribal 15-1D-55 ,| 5 S 5 W 4301352647 1948/. OilWell Producing
State Tribal 10-1D-55 1 5 S 5 W 4301352648 19485 OilWell Producino
State Tribal 9-1D-55 I 5 S 5 W 4301352649 19486 OilWell
LC FEE 16-15D-56 14 5 S o W 4301352655 19520 OilWell Producing
LC Tribal 2-22D-56 22 5 S o W 4301352663 19548 OilWell Producinq
LC Tribal 3-22D-56 22 5 S o W 4301352664 19549 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14.30D.55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352687 19836 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-3OD-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352688 19743 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 12-3OD-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352689 '19744 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 11-30D.55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352690 19745 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 12.31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352699 19774 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 13-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352700 19775 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14.31D.55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352701, 19776 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-3.I-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352703 19777 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 9-3OD-55 30 5 S 5 W 430',t352731 19732 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 15-3OD-55 30 5 S 5 W 430',t352737 19725 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 3-31D.55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352757 19778 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352758 '19779 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301 3527s9 19746 OilWell Producing
FederalS-14D-65 14 6 S 5 W 4301352767 19592 OilWell Producino
FederalT-14D-65 14 6 S 5 W 4301352768 19593 OilWell Producing
Federal2-14D-65 14 6 5 W 4301352769 19594 OilWell Producino

31 6t14t2017

VellTransfer
rom: LinnOperating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

Ë¾ective:3/1/2017
UTETTilELAL12-5D-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352480 19499 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352484 19500 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 14-5D-5.4 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352493 19510 OilVVell P·roducirm
Federal14-ISD-65 __ 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352495 19610 OilVVell Producirm
Federal 13-6D-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301352496 19611 OilWell Producing
Federal 11-6D-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301352497 19591 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 16-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352545 19335 OilWell Producing
UteTribal15-5D-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352546 19358 OilVVell Produciry
UteTribal10-50-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352547 19359 OilVVell Producirm
UteTiibal8-5D-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352548 19336 OilVVell Producing
StateTribal13-11D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301352561 19519 OilVVell P·roducirm
State Tribal 1-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352568 19434 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 2-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352576 19427 OilWell Producing
StateTribal8-18D-54 18 5 S 4 VV 4301352577 19428 OilVVell P'roducirgi
Federal16-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352590 19616 OilVVell Producirm
Federal 15-6D-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301352591 19617 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 428D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352607 19435 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 3-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352608 19436 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 6-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352609 19437 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 5-12-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352643 19446 OilWell Producing
StateTribal12-12D-55 12 5 S 5 VV 4301352644 19447 OilVVell Producirm
State Tribal 6-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352645 19438 Oil Well Producing
StateTribal16-1D-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301352646 19483 OilVVell Producirm
State Tribal 15-1D-55 1 5 S 5 W 4301352647 19484 OilWell Producing
StateTribal10-1D-55 1 5 Si 5 VV 4301352648 19485 OilVVell Producing
StateTribal9-1D-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301352649 19486 Oil\¾ell Producing
LC FEE 16-150-56 14 5 S 6 VV 4301352655 19520 OilVVell Producing
LC Tribal 2-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301352663 19548 OilWell Producing
LC Tribal 3-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301352664 19549 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-30D-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352687 19836 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352688 19743 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL 12|-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352689 19744 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL 11-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352690 19745 OilVVell P'roducirmi
UTE TRIBAL12-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352699 19774 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352700 19775 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL14-31D-55 31 5 S 5 VV 4301352701 19776 OilVVell Producirmi
UTE TRIBAL 11-31-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352703 19777 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL9-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352731 19732 OilVVell P'roducirmi
UTETRIBAL 15-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352737 19725 OilVVell Producirm
UTE TRIBAL 3-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352757 19778 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352758 19779 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352759 19746 OilWell Producing
Federal8-14D-65 14 6 S 5 VV 4301352767 19592 OilVVell Producin9Federal7-14D-65 14 6 S 5 VV 4301352768 19593 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal2-14D-65 14 6 S 5 VV 4301352769 19594 OilVVell Producing
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VellTransfer
rom: LinnOperating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC

Ë¾ective:3/1/2017
UTETTilELAL12-5D-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352480 19499 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352484 19500 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL 14-5D-5.4 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352493 19510 OilVVell P·roducirm
Federal14-ISD-65 __ 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352495 19610 OilVVell Producirm
Federal 13-6D-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301352496 19611 OilWell Producing
Federal 11-6D-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301352497 19591 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 16-5D-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301352545 19335 OilWell Producing
UteTribal15-5D-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352546 19358 OilVVell Produciry
UteTribal10-50-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352547 19359 OilVVell Producirm
UteTiibal8-5D-54 5 5 S 4 VV 4301352548 19336 OilVVell Producing
StateTribal13-11D-54 10 5 S 4 VV 4301352561 19519 OilVVell P·roducirm
State Tribal 1-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352568 19434 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 2-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352576 19427 OilWell Producing
StateTribal8-18D-54 18 5 S 4 VV 4301352577 19428 OilVVell P'roducirgi
Federal16-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352590 19616 OilVVell Producirm
Federal 15-6D-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301352591 19617 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 428D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352607 19435 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 3-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352608 19436 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 6-18D-54 18 5 S 4 W 4301352609 19437 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 5-12-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352643 19446 OilWell Producing
StateTribal12-12D-55 12 5 S 5 VV 4301352644 19447 OilVVell Producirm
State Tribal 6-12D-55 12 5 S 5 W 4301352645 19438 Oil Well Producing
StateTribal16-1D-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301352646 19483 OilVVell Producirm
State Tribal 15-1D-55 1 5 S 5 W 4301352647 19484 OilWell Producing
StateTribal10-1D-55 1 5 Si 5 VV 4301352648 19485 OilVVell Producing
StateTribal9-1D-55 1 5 S 5 VV 4301352649 19486 Oil\¾ell Producing
LC FEE 16-150-56 14 5 S 6 VV 4301352655 19520 OilVVell Producing
LC Tribal 2-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301352663 19548 OilWell Producing
LC Tribal 3-22D-56 22 5 S 6 W 4301352664 19549 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL14-30D-55 30 5 S 5 W 4301352687 19836 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352688 19743 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL 12|-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352689 19744 OilVVell Producirmi
UTETRIBAL 11-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352690 19745 OilVVell P'roducirmi
UTE TRIBAL12-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352699 19774 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL13-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352700 19775 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL14-31D-55 31 5 S 5 VV 4301352701 19776 OilVVell Producirmi
UTE TRIBAL 11-31-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352703 19777 OilWell Producing
UTETRIBAL9-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352731 19732 OilVVell P'roducirmi
UTETRIBAL 15-30D-55 30 5 S 5 VV 4301352737 19725 OilVVell Producirm
UTE TRIBAL 3-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352757 19778 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352758 19779 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-55 31 5 S 5 W 4301352759 19746 OilWell Producing
Federal8-14D-65 14 6 S 5 VV 4301352767 19592 OilVVell Producin9Federal7-14D-65 14 6 S 5 VV 4301352768 19593 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal2-14D-65 14 6 S 5 VV 4301352769 19594 OilVVell Producing
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

Federal 1-'l4D-65 14 6 S 5 W 4301352770 '19595 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4.31D.55 31 5 S 5 W 430135279s 19780 OilWell Producino
Federal 1-13D-65 13 6 S 5 W 4301 352800 19595 OilWell Producinq
Federal 2-13-65 13 6 S 5 W 4301 352801 1 9501 OilWell Producino
Federal 7-13D-65 't3 6 S 5 W 430',t352802 1 9597 OilWell Producino
Federal 8-13D-65 13 6 S 5 W 4301 352803 't9502 OilWell Producinq
Federal 12-BD-64 7 6 S 4 W 430',t352832 1 9550 OilWell Producing
Federal5-8D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301 352833 19551 OilWell Producino
Federal4-8D-64 7 o S 4 W 4301352834 19552 OilWell Producing
Federal3-8D-64 5 o S 4 W 4301352845 19503 OilWell Producinq
MAY UTE FED 1-1381 13 2 S ,| W 4304730176 5435 OilWell Producinq
cooK 1-2681 26 2 S 1 W 4304731981 1',t2',t2 OilWell Producing
CHRISTIANSEN 2..I281 12 2 S 1 W 4304732178 1 1350 OilWell Producing
RtcH 2-13B1 13 2 S 1 W 4304732744 12046 OilWell Producing
THOMAS 4-10B1 10 2 S 1 W 4304734080 't3284 OilWell Producinq
HAMAKER 3-'1281 12 2 S 1 W 4304752294 18650 OilWell Producinq
BETTS 2-2681 26 2 S 1 W 4304752435 18698 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 4H-31-56 31 5 S 6 W 4301351738 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Fee 11-22-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301352127 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Fee 13-22D-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301352131 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 5-220-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301352133 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 15-22D-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301352134 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 11-18D-56 18 5 S o W 430',t352140 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 13-18D-56 18 5 S o W 4301352',t41 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 15-18D-56 18 5 S E W 4301352142 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC TribalT-18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352153 OilWell Retumed APD (Unaooroved)
LC TribalS-18D-56 18 5 S c W 4301352154 OilWell Returned APD (Unaoproved)
LC Tribal3-18-56 18 5 S c W 4301 3521 55 OilWell Retumed APD (Unaooroved)
LC Tribal6-19D-56 19 5 S c W 4301352247 OilWell Retumed APD (Unaooroved)
LC Tribal4-19D-56 19 5 S c W 4301352248 OilWell Retumed APD (Unaooroved)
Abbott Fee 3-6D-54 o 5 S 4 W 430',t352325 OilWell BelqEqE4PD ( U napproved)
LC Fee 9-1 1D-56 't1 5 S 3 W 4301352479 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams Tribal 8-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352650 OilWell Returned APD (Unaooroved)
Williams Tribal 7-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352651 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams 1 ribal 2-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352652 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams Tribal 1-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352653 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Foy Fee 12-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301353087 OilWell Returned APD (Unaooroved)
Foy Fee 6-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301 353088 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
F_oy teS 5-94Q:99 34 5 S 5 W 430'1353089 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Foy Fee 3-34D-55 34 5 S 5 y1/ 4301353090 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Foy Tribal 13-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 43013531 19 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
Foy Tribal 14-34-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301353120 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
UTE FEE 1O-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301353129 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 10-15D-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301 353163 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)

C Tribal9-21D-56 21 5 S 6 W 4301 353164 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)

32 6t14t2017

"VellTransfer
Prom: Linn Operating, Inc.
'o: Linn Operation, LLC
¯ffective: 3/1/2017
Federal1-14D-65 14 6 S 5 VV 4301352770 19595 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL4-31D-55 31 5 S 5 VV 4301352795 19780 Oil\Nell Producing
Fedenal1-13D-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352800 19596 OilVVell Producing
Federal2-13-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352801 19501 OilVVell_ Producing
Fedenal7-13D-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352802 19597 OilVVell P'roducingi
Fedenal8-13D-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352803 19502 OilVVell Producing
Federal 12-8D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301352832 19550 OilWell Producing
Fedenal5-80-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301352833 19551 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal4-8D-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301352834 19552 OilViell Producing
Èederal3-8D-64 5 6 S 4 W 4301352845 19503 OilWell Producing
MAYUTE FED 1-13B1 13 2 S 1 W 4304730176 5435 OilWell Producing
CCK3K1-26B1 26 2 S _1 VV 4304731981 11212 Oil\Nell Producing
CHRISTIANSEN2-12B1 12 2 S 1 VV 4304732178 11350 Oil\Nell Producing
RICH2-13B1 13 2 S 1 VV 4304732744 12046 OilVVell Producing
T gl4-10B1 10 2 S 1 VV 4304734080 13284 OilVVell Producing
Ei4MAKER3-12B1 12 2 S 1 VV 4304752294 18650 OilVVell Producing
BETTS2-26B1 26 2 S 1 VV 4304752435 18698 OilVVell Producingi
LC TRIBAL 4H-31-56 31 5 S 6 W 4301351738 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved
LC Fee 11-22-57 22 5 S 7 VV 4301352127 OilVVell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Fee 13-22D-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301352131 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 5-22D-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301352133 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 15-22D-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301352134 OilWell Returned APD Unapprovedi
LC Tribal 11-18D-56 18 5 S 6

¯
VV 4301352140 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved

LC Tribal 13-18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352141 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 15-18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352142 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 7-18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352153 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 5-18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352154 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 3-18-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352155 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 6-19D-56 19 5 S 6 W 4301352247 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 4-19D-56 19 5 S 6 W 4301352248 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
Abbott Fee 3-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352325 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
LC Fee 9-11D-56 11 5 S 6 W 4301352479 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved
Williams Tribal 8-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352650 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams Tribal 7-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352651 _ OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams Tribal 2-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352652 OilWell Returned APD (UnapprovedL
Williams Tribal 1-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352653 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Foy Fee 12-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301353087 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Foy Fee 6-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301353088 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
FoyFee5-34D-55 34 5 S 5 VV 4301353089 Oil\Nell ReturnedAPD(Unaggrovegl
Foy Fee 3-34D-55 34 5 _ S 5 W 4301353090 OilWell Returned APD (UnapprovedL
Foy Tribal 13-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301353119 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
Foy Tribal 14-34-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301353120 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
UTE FEE 10-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301353129 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 10-15D-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301353163 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 9-21D-56 21 5 S 6 W 4301353164 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
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"VellTransfer
Prom: Linn Operating, Inc.
'o: Linn Operation, LLC
¯ffective: 3/1/2017
Federal1-14D-65 14 6 S 5 VV 4301352770 19595 OilVVell Producing
UTETRIBAL4-31D-55 31 5 S 5 VV 4301352795 19780 Oil\Nell Producing
Fedenal1-13D-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352800 19596 OilVVell Producing
Federal2-13-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352801 19501 OilVVell_ Producing
Fedenal7-13D-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352802 19597 OilVVell P'roducingi
Fedenal8-13D-65 13 6 S 5 VV 4301352803 19502 OilVVell Producing
Federal 12-8D-64 7 6 S 4 W 4301352832 19550 OilWell Producing
Fedenal5-80-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301352833 19551 OilVVell Producing
Fedenal4-8D-64 7 6 S 4 VV 4301352834 19552 OilViell Producing
Èederal3-8D-64 5 6 S 4 W 4301352845 19503 OilWell Producing
MAYUTE FED 1-13B1 13 2 S 1 W 4304730176 5435 OilWell Producing
CCK3K1-26B1 26 2 S _1 VV 4304731981 11212 Oil\Nell Producing
CHRISTIANSEN2-12B1 12 2 S 1 VV 4304732178 11350 Oil\Nell Producing
RICH2-13B1 13 2 S 1 VV 4304732744 12046 OilVVell Producing
T gl4-10B1 10 2 S 1 VV 4304734080 13284 OilVVell Producing
Ei4MAKER3-12B1 12 2 S 1 VV 4304752294 18650 OilVVell Producing
BETTS2-26B1 26 2 S 1 VV 4304752435 18698 OilVVell Producingi
LC TRIBAL 4H-31-56 31 5 S 6 W 4301351738 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved
LC Fee 11-22-57 22 5 S 7 VV 4301352127 OilVVell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Fee 13-22D-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301352131 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 5-22D-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301352133 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 15-22D-57 22 5 S 7 W 4301352134 OilWell Returned APD Unapprovedi
LC Tribal 11-18D-56 18 5 S 6

¯
VV 4301352140 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved

LC Tribal 13-18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352141 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 15-18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352142 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 7-18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352153 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 5-18D-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352154 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 3-18-56 18 5 S 6 W 4301352155 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 6-19D-56 19 5 S 6 W 4301352247 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 4-19D-56 19 5 S 6 W 4301352248 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
Abbott Fee 3-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352325 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
LC Fee 9-11D-56 11 5 S 6 W 4301352479 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved
Williams Tribal 8-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352650 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams Tribal 7-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352651 _ OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams Tribal 2-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352652 OilWell Returned APD (UnapprovedL
Williams Tribal 1-4D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352653 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Foy Fee 12-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301353087 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Foy Fee 6-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301353088 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
FoyFee5-34D-55 34 5 S 5 VV 4301353089 Oil\Nell ReturnedAPD(Unaggrovegl
Foy Fee 3-34D-55 34 5 _ S 5 W 4301353090 OilWell Returned APD (UnapprovedL
Foy Tribal 13-34D-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301353119 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
Foy Tribal 14-34-55 34 5 S 5 W 4301353120 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
UTE FEE 10-13D-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301353129 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 10-15D-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301353163 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 9-21D-56 21 5 S 6 W 4301353164 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

LC TribalT-21D-56 21 5 S c W 4301353165 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)

LC Tribal 11-15D-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301353189 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)

SCOFIELD THORPE 22.41X RIG SKID 22 12 S 7 E 4300730890 13719 Gas Well Shut-in
SCOFIELD-THORPE 35-13 35 12 S 7 E 4300730991 14846 Gas Well Shut-in
SCOFIELD-THORPE 23-31 23 12 S 7 E 430073100'l 14923 Gas Well Shut-in
STATE 1]top2 (3-10C) 10 1 S 2 W 4301330006 5860 Gas Well Shut-in
DOUG BROWN 2.442 4 1 S 2 W 4301330017 5840 OilWell Shut-in

BOREN U 5.22A2 22 1 S 2 W 4301330107 5900 OilWell Shut-in
BOREN U 6-1642 16 1 S 2 W 4301 330123 5750 OilWell Shut-in

UTE TRIBAL 1-683 6 2 S 3 W 4301 3301 36 5705 OilWell Shut-in
CAMPBELL UTE ST 1-781 7 2 S ,l W 4301 330236 5295 OilWell Shut-in
WIRE FENCE CYN FED 15-1 15 o S 5 W 4301330404 8233 Gas Well Shut-in
R FORKANTELOPE CYN FED 25-1 25 6 S 5 W 4301 330406 8234 OilWell Shut-in
WOLF HOLLOW 22.1 22 5 S 5 W 4301330425 10370 Gas Well Shut-in
D L GALLOWAY 'I-1482 14 2 S 2 W 4301330564 5965 OilWell Shut-in
LAMTCO 2-68l o 2 S I W 4301330809 230',| OilWell Shut-in
HAMBLIN 2-26.M 26 1 S 2 uV 430't330903 5361 OilWell Shut-in
LAMICQ 2.20F2 20 1 S 2 W 4301331 191 10794 OilWell Shut-in
MARK 2-25M 25 1 S 2 W 4301331232 10986 OilWell Shut-in
ZandT UTE TRIBAL 12-22 22 5 S 4 W 430133131 1 11421 OilWell Shut-in
MITCHELL 2-481 4 2 S 1 W 4301331317 11231 OilWell Shut-in
CHAPMAN 2.482 2 S 2 W 4301331378 I 1485 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 15.17 17 5 S 4 W 4301331649 1 1956 OilWell Shut-in
POWELL 2-1681 16 2 S 1 W 4301331820 12342 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 3-19 't9 5 s 4 W 4301331830 't2197 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 14-17 17 5 S 4 rA/ 4301332',t47 '12755 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIB4\L 7-30
UTE TRIBAL 1-33

30 5 S 4 W 4301332167 12945 OilWell Shut-in
33 5 S 4 W 430't332185 't3024 OilWell Shut-in

UTE TRIBAL 5-24-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301332263 13621 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 10.16.55 16 5 S 5 W 4301332345 1 3693 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 15-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332382 13944 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 14-2'I-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332384 13946 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 13.30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332409 13968 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 3-33.54 33 5 S 4 W 43013324'.t2 1 3938 OilWell Shuhin
UTE TRIBAL 1.20.55 20 5 S 5 W 43013324',t4 14548 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 9-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332566 14369 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 6-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 430't332570 't4299 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1O-14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301332601 1433',1 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1'1.5-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301332664 14415 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 16.24-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301332672 14384 Gas Well Shut-in
MYRIN TRIBAL 14.19-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301332782 15184 OilWell Shut-in

oN TRTBAL 13-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332801 15057 OilWell Shut-in
oN TRTBAL 11-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332845 15135 OilWell Shut-in

TRTBAL 15-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332855 151',14 OilWell Shut-in
: TRIBAL 10-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332932 15364 OilWell Shut-in

33 6t14t2017

ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective: 3/1/2017
LC Tribal 7-21D-56 21 5 S 6 W 4301353165 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 11-150-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301353189 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
SCOFIELD THORPE 22-41X RIG SKID 22 12 S 7 E 4300730890 13719 Gas Well Shut-in
SCOFIELD-THORPE 35-13 35 12 S 7 E 4300730991 14846 Gas Well Shut-in
SCOFIELD-THORPE 23-31 23 12 S 7 E 4300731001 14923 Gas Well Shut-in
STATE 1-10A2 (3-10C) 10 1 S 2 W 4301330006 5860 Gas Well Shut-in
DOUG BROWN 2-4A2 4 1 S 2 W 4301330017 5840 OilWell Shut-in
L BOREN U 5-22A2 22 1 S 2 W 4301330107 5900 OilWell Shut-in
L BOREN U 6-16A2 16 1 S 2 W 4301330123 5750 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1-6B3 6 2 S 3 W 4301330136 5705 OilWell Shut-in
CAMPBELL UTE ST 1-7B1 7 2 S 1 W 4301330236 5295 OilWell Shut-in
WIRE FENCE CYN FED 15-1 15 6 S 5 W 4301330404 8233 Gas Well Shut-in
R FORK ANTELOPE CYN FED 25-1 25 6 S 5 W 4301330406 8234 OilWell Shut-in
WOLF HOLLOW 22-1 22 6 S 5 W 4301330425 10370 Gas Well Shut-in
DL GALLOWAY 1-14B2 14 2 S 2 W 4301330564 5965 OilWell Shut-in
LAMICQ2-6B1 6 2 S 1 W 4301330809 2301 OilWell Shut-in
HAMBLIN 2-26-A2 26 i S 2 W 4301330903 5361 OilWell Shut-in
LAMICQ2-20A2 20 1 S 2 W 4301331191 10794 OilWell Shut-in
ÃlIÄRK2-25A2 25 1 S 2 W 4301331232 10986 OilWell Shut-in

dT UTE TRIBAL12-22 22 5 S 4 W 4301331311 11421 OilWell Shut-in
MITCHELL2-4B1 4 2 S 1 W 4301331317 11231 OilWell Shut-in
CHAPMAN 2-4B2 4 2 S 2 W 4301331378 11485 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 15-17 17 5 S 4 W 4301331649 11956 OilWell Shut-in
POWELL 2-16B1 16 2 S 1 W 4301331820 12342 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL3-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301331830 12197 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 14-17 17 5 S 4 W 4301332147 12755 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 7-30 30 5 S 4 W 4301332167 12945 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1-33 33 5 S 4 W 4301332185 13024 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 5-24-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301332263 13621 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 10-16-55 16 5 S 5 W 4301332345 13693 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL15-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332382 13944 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 14-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332384 13946 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL13-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332409 13968 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332412 13938 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1-20-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301332414 14548 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL9-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332566 14369 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL6-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332570 14299 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL10-14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301332601 14331 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL11-5-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301332664 14415 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301332672 14384 Gas Well Shut-in
MYRINTRIBAL14-19-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301332782 15184 OilWell Shut-in
MOON TRIBAL 13-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332801 15057 OilWell Shut-in
MOONTRIBAL 11-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332845 15135 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL15-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332855 15114 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL10-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332932 15364 OilWell Shut-in
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ell Transfer
rom: Linn Operating, Inc.
o: Linn Operation, LLC
iffective: 3/1/2017
LC Tribal 7-21D-56 21 5 S 6 W 4301353165 OilWell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 11-150-56 15 5 S 6 W 4301353189 OilWell Retumed APD (Unapproved)
SCOFIELD THORPE 22-41X RIG SKID 22 12 S 7 E 4300730890 13719 Gas Well Shut-in
SCOFIELD-THORPE 35-13 35 12 S 7 E 4300730991 14846 Gas Well Shut-in
SCOFIELD-THORPE 23-31 23 12 S 7 E 4300731001 14923 Gas Well Shut-in
STATE 1-10A2 (3-10C) 10 1 S 2 W 4301330006 5860 Gas Well Shut-in
DOUG BROWN 2-4A2 4 1 S 2 W 4301330017 5840 OilWell Shut-in
L BOREN U 5-22A2 22 1 S 2 W 4301330107 5900 OilWell Shut-in
L BOREN U 6-16A2 16 1 S 2 W 4301330123 5750 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1-6B3 6 2 S 3 W 4301330136 5705 OilWell Shut-in
CAMPBELL UTE ST 1-7B1 7 2 S 1 W 4301330236 5295 OilWell Shut-in
WIRE FENCE CYN FED 15-1 15 6 S 5 W 4301330404 8233 Gas Well Shut-in
R FORK ANTELOPE CYN FED 25-1 25 6 S 5 W 4301330406 8234 OilWell Shut-in
WOLF HOLLOW 22-1 22 6 S 5 W 4301330425 10370 Gas Well Shut-in
DL GALLOWAY 1-14B2 14 2 S 2 W 4301330564 5965 OilWell Shut-in
LAMICQ2-6B1 6 2 S 1 W 4301330809 2301 OilWell Shut-in
HAMBLIN 2-26-A2 26 i S 2 W 4301330903 5361 OilWell Shut-in
LAMICQ2-20A2 20 1 S 2 W 4301331191 10794 OilWell Shut-in
ÃlIÄRK2-25A2 25 1 S 2 W 4301331232 10986 OilWell Shut-in

dT UTE TRIBAL12-22 22 5 S 4 W 4301331311 11421 OilWell Shut-in
MITCHELL2-4B1 4 2 S 1 W 4301331317 11231 OilWell Shut-in
CHAPMAN 2-4B2 4 2 S 2 W 4301331378 11485 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 15-17 17 5 S 4 W 4301331649 11956 OilWell Shut-in
POWELL 2-16B1 16 2 S 1 W 4301331820 12342 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL3-19 19 5 S 4 W 4301331830 12197 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 14-17 17 5 S 4 W 4301332147 12755 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 7-30 30 5 S 4 W 4301332167 12945 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1-33 33 5 S 4 W 4301332185 13024 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 5-24-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301332263 13621 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 10-16-55 16 5 S 5 W 4301332345 13693 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL15-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332382 13944 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 14-21-54 21 5 S 4 W 4301332384 13946 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL13-30-54 30 5 S 4 W 4301332409 13968 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54 33 5 S 4 W 4301332412 13938 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1-20-55 20 5 S 5 W 4301332414 14548 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL9-29-54 29 5 S 4 W 4301332566 14369 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL6-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332570 14299 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL10-14-55 14 5 S 5 W 4301332601 14331 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL11-5-54 5 5 S 4 W 4301332664 14415 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-55 24 5 S 5 W 4301332672 14384 Gas Well Shut-in
MYRINTRIBAL14-19-55 19 5 S 5 W 4301332782 15184 OilWell Shut-in
MOON TRIBAL 13-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332801 15057 OilWell Shut-in
MOONTRIBAL 11-27-54 27 5 S 4 W 4301332845 15135 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL15-15-55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332855 15114 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL10-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301332932 15364 OilWell Shut-in
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WellTransfer
From: Linn Operating, lnc.
To: Linn Operation, LLC

1

UTE TRIBAL 8-24-54 24 5 S 4 W 4301 332933 15402 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL '12.15.55 15 5 S 5 W 4301332981 15348 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 2.23-55 23 5 S 5 W 4301333045 15416 OilWell Shut-in
TAYLOR FEET-14-56 14 5 S 6 W 4301333140 15601 OilWell Shut-in
wtLcox FEE 15-16-56 16 5 S 6 W 4301333151 15527 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 11.13.55 13 5 S 5 W 4301333268 't5692 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 7.14-55 't4 5 S 5 W 4301333269 15693 OilWell Shut-in
14-11-56 DLB 't'l 5 S 6 W 4301 333378 1 5801 OilWell Shut-in
FEDERAL 10.3-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301333386 't6297 OilWell Shut-in
BERRY TRIBAL 16-34D.54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333464 16280 OilWell Shut-in
:EDERAL'10-2-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301333542 16181 OilWell Shut-in
JTE FEE 2.13.55 13 5 S 5 W 4301333720 't8659 OilWell Shut-in
_c TRTBAL 13-16D-56 16 5 S 6 W 4301334282 17601 OilWell strqtin

Shut-in_c TRTBAL 4-27D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301350262 1 7568 OilWell
_c TRTBAL 8-16D-56 16 5 s 6 W 4301350599 18161 OilWell Shut-in
-c TRTBAL 15-8D-56 8 5 S 6 W 4301351060 18862 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 6.9.54 I 5 S 4 W 430',t35'.t127 19017 OilWell Shut-in
rc TRTBAL 16-30D-56 30 5 S 6 W 430',t351132 18540 OilWell Shut-in
STATE TRIBAL 156-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301351227 18746 OilWell Shut-in
-c TRTBAL 1-29-56 29 5 S 6 W 430135',t442 18876 OilWell Shut-in
3C Fee 7R-28-38 28 3 S 8 W 4301351852 18863 OilWell Shut-in
qBBOfi FEE 8-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 430't351950 18964 OilWell Shut-in
rederal 1-9D-64 I 6 S 4 W 4301 352020 19722 OilWell Shut-in
trEDERAL 14-9D-64 o 6 S 4 W 4301 352040 19690 OilWell Shut-in

e Tribal 124D-54 4 5 S 4 W 4301352344 19352 OilWell Shut-in
ate Tribal 10-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301 352395 19425 OilWell Shut-in

te Tribal 14-6D-54 o 5 S 4 W 4301 352455 19477 OilWell Shut-in
leral 10-6D-65 o 6 S 5 W 4301 352498 19612 OilWell Shut-in
leral2-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352537 19630 OilWell Shut-in

:ederalS-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301 352538 19613 OilWell Shut-in
:ederal4-7D-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352541 19614 OilWell Shut-in
=ederal 3-7-65 7 6 S 5 W 4301352560 19609 OilWell Shut-in
:ederal 1-7D-65 6 6 S 5 W 4301352589 19615 OilWell Shut-in
IBRTSN UTE ST 1-'1281 12 2 S 1 W 4304730164 5475 OilWell Shut-in

34 6l't4t2017

Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: LinnOperation, LLC
iñective:3/1/2017
UTETTRIEb4L8-24-54 24 5 S 4 VV 4301332933 15402 OilVVell Shut-in
LÏÌE TitlEUAL12-15-55 15 5 S 5 VV 4301332981 15348 OilVVell Shut-in
UTETRIBAL2-23-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301333045 15416 OilVVell Shut-in
TAYLORFEE7-14-56 14 5 S 6 VV 4301333140 15601 OilVVell Shut-in
VVILCCD(FEE15-16-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301333151 15527 OilVVell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301333268 15692 OilWell Shut-in
UTETRIBAi7-14-55 14 5 S 5 VV 4301333269 15693 OilVVell Shut-ir
14-11-56 DLB 11 5 S 6 W 4301333378 15801 OilWell Shut-in
FEDERAL 10-3-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301333386 16297 OilWell Shut-in
BERRYTRIBAL16-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333464 16280 OilWell Shut-in
FEDERAL 10-2-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301333542 16181 OilWell Shut-in
UTE FEE2-13-55 13 5 S 5 VV 4301333720 18659 OilVVell Shut-in
LC TRIBAL13-16D-56 16 5 S 6 W 4301334282 17601 OilWell Shut-in
LC TRIBAL4-27D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301350262 17568 OilWell Shut-in
LCTTilEL4L8-16D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301350599 18161 OilVVell Shut-in
LC TTilEL4L15-80-56 8 5 S 6 VV 4301351060 18862 OilVVell Shut-ir
UTETRIBAd.6-9-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351127 19017 OilVVell Shut-ir
LCTTRIELAL16-30D-56 30 5 S 6 VV 4301351132 18540 OilVVell Stiut-in
STATETRIBAL154-54 6 5 S 4 VV 4301351227 18746 Oil\Nell Shut-in
LCTTRIELAL1-29-56 29 5 S 6 VV 4301351442 18876 OilVVell Shut-in
CCFee7R-28-38 28 3 S 8 VV 4301351852 18863 OilVVell Shut-in
AJ3BCYTTFEE8-6D-54 6 5 S 4 \N 4301351950 18964 OilVVell Shut-in
Federal1-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352020 19722 OilVVell Shut-in
FEDERAL 14-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352040 19690 OilVVell Shut-in
UteTribal12-4D-54 4 5 S 4 VV 4301352344 19352 OilVVell Shut-in
State Tribal 10-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352395 19425 OilWell Shut-in
ŠtateTribal14-6D-54 6 5 S 4 VV 4301352455 19477 OilVVell Shut-in
Federal10-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352498 19612 OilVVell Shut-in
Federal2-7D-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352537 19630 Oil\Nell Shut-in
Fedenal5-7D-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352538 19613 OilVVell Shut-ir
Federal4-70-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352541 19614 Oil\Nell Shut-in
Federal3-7-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352560 19609 Oil\Nell Shut-in
Fedenal1-7D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352589 19615 OilVVell Shut-in
RBRTSN UTEST 1-12B1 12 2 S 1 VV 4304730164 5475 OilVVell Shut-in

34

Well Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: LinnOperation, LLC
iñective:3/1/2017
UTETTRIEb4L8-24-54 24 5 S 4 VV 4301332933 15402 OilVVell Shut-in
LÏÌE TitlEUAL12-15-55 15 5 S 5 VV 4301332981 15348 OilVVell Shut-in
UTETRIBAL2-23-55 23 5 S 5 VV 4301333045 15416 OilVVell Shut-in
TAYLORFEE7-14-56 14 5 S 6 VV 4301333140 15601 OilVVell Shut-in
VVILCCD(FEE15-16-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301333151 15527 OilVVell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-55 13 5 S 5 W 4301333268 15692 OilWell Shut-in
UTETRIBAi7-14-55 14 5 S 5 VV 4301333269 15693 OilVVell Shut-ir
14-11-56 DLB 11 5 S 6 W 4301333378 15801 OilWell Shut-in
FEDERAL 10-3-65 3 6 S 5 W 4301333386 16297 OilWell Shut-in
BERRYTRIBAL16-34D-54 34 5 S 4 W 4301333464 16280 OilWell Shut-in
FEDERAL 10-2-65 2 6 S 5 W 4301333542 16181 OilWell Shut-in
UTE FEE2-13-55 13 5 S 5 VV 4301333720 18659 OilVVell Shut-in
LC TRIBAL13-16D-56 16 5 S 6 W 4301334282 17601 OilWell Shut-in
LC TRIBAL4-27D-56 27 5 S 6 W 4301350262 17568 OilWell Shut-in
LCTTilEL4L8-16D-56 16 5 S 6 VV 4301350599 18161 OilVVell Shut-in
LC TTilEL4L15-80-56 8 5 S 6 VV 4301351060 18862 OilVVell Shut-ir
UTETRIBAd.6-9-54 9 5 S 4 VV 4301351127 19017 OilVVell Shut-ir
LCTTRIELAL16-30D-56 30 5 S 6 VV 4301351132 18540 OilVVell Stiut-in
STATETRIBAL154-54 6 5 S 4 VV 4301351227 18746 Oil\Nell Shut-in
LCTTRIELAL1-29-56 29 5 S 6 VV 4301351442 18876 OilVVell Shut-in
CCFee7R-28-38 28 3 S 8 VV 4301351852 18863 OilVVell Shut-in
AJ3BCYTTFEE8-6D-54 6 5 S 4 \N 4301351950 18964 OilVVell Shut-in
Federal1-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352020 19722 OilVVell Shut-in
FEDERAL 14-9D-64 9 6 S 4 VV 4301352040 19690 OilVVell Shut-in
UteTribal12-4D-54 4 5 S 4 VV 4301352344 19352 OilVVell Shut-in
State Tribal 10-6D-54 6 5 S 4 W 4301352395 19425 OilWell Shut-in
ŠtateTribal14-6D-54 6 5 S 4 VV 4301352455 19477 OilVVell Shut-in
Federal10-6D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352498 19612 OilVVell Shut-in
Federal2-7D-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352537 19630 Oil\Nell Shut-in
Fedenal5-7D-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352538 19613 OilVVell Shut-ir
Federal4-70-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352541 19614 Oil\Nell Shut-in
Federal3-7-65 7 6 S 5 VV 4301352560 19609 Oil\Nell Shut-in
Fedenal1-7D-65 6 6 S 5 VV 4301352589 19615 OilVVell Shut-in
RBRTSN UTEST 1-12B1 12 2 S 1 VV 4304730164 5475 OilVVell Shut-in

34



Facili$ Transfer
From: Linn Operating, [nc.
To: Linn Operating, LLC
Effective: March 1, 2017

Facilitv Name Facilitv Status Facilitv Tvoe Sec TWN RNG Qtr/Qtr
Boren Active Tank Batterv 23 1 2 NENW
Chevron Pump Station Active Tank Batterv 22 1 2
Davis Hollow Active Compressor Station 5 tt SESW
LINN ENERGY, LLC Active Gas Plant
Scofleld Active Compressor Station 26 12 7
Section 21 Active Compressor Station 21 5 5 NENE
Section 22 Active Compressor Station 22 5 4 NWSW
Section 23 Active Compressor Station 23s 4 NESE
Section 34 Active Compressor Station 34 5 4 NENW
Section 7 Active Compressor Station 7 5 4 NWSW
Skitzy Active Compressor Station 3 5 6 SWSW
Ute Pipeline Active Compressor Station 22 5 4 NWSW
Ute Pipeline 21 Active Compressor Stiation 21 5 5 NENE
Ute Pipeline 7 Active Compressor Station 7 5 5 NESW

6t13t2017

Facility Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operating, LLC
Effective: March 1, 2017

Facility Name Facility Status Facility Type Sec TWN RNG OtrlQtr
Boren Active Tank Battery 23 1 2 NENW
Chevron Pump Station Active Tank Battery 22 1 2
Davis Hollow Active Compressor Station 5 6 SESW
LINN ENERGY, LLC Active Gas Plant
Scofield Active Compressor Station 26 12 7
Section 21 Active Compressor Station 21 5 5 NENE
Section 22 Active Compressor Station 22 5 4 NWSW
Section 23 Active Compressor Station 23 5 4 NESE
Section 34 Active Compressor Station 34 5 4 NENW
Section 7 Active Compressor Station 7 5 4 NWSW
Skitzy Active Compressor Station 3 5 6 SWSW
Ute Pipeline Active Compressor Station 22 5 4 NWSW
Ute Pipeline 21 Active Compressor Station 21 5 5 NENE
Ute Pipeline 7 Active Compressor Station 7 5 5 NESW

1

Facility Transfer
From: Linn Operating, Inc.
To: Linn Operating, LLC
Effective: March 1, 2017

Facility Name Facility Status Facility Type Sec TWN RNG OtrlQtr
Boren Active Tank Battery 23 1 2 NENW
Chevron Pump Station Active Tank Battery 22 1 2
Davis Hollow Active Compressor Station 5 6 SESW
LINN ENERGY, LLC Active Gas Plant
Scofield Active Compressor Station 26 12 7
Section 21 Active Compressor Station 21 5 5 NENE
Section 22 Active Compressor Station 22 5 4 NWSW
Section 23 Active Compressor Station 23 5 4 NESE
Section 34 Active Compressor Station 34 5 4 NENW
Section 7 Active Compressor Station 7 5 4 NWSW
Skitzy Active Compressor Station 3 5 6 SWSW
Ute Pipeline Active Compressor Station 22 5 4 NWSW
Ute Pipeline 21 Active Compressor Station 21 5 5 NENE
Ute Pipeline 7 Active Compressor Station 7 5 5 NESW

1



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATUML RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

AND SERIT{L NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Oo not usB this fotm for proposals to drill ns\fl wolls, significantly deepen existing wells belov cunsnt bottom+lole depth, re€nter pluggsd wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such

1. TYPEOFVVELL
otL wELL n cAS wELL f] orHER see attached

see attached list
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE

8. \,ELL NAME and NUMBER:

see attached list
9. API NUMBER:

10, FIELDAND POOL, OR WLOCAT:

couNrY: Duchesne

STATE:

UTAH

:. NAME (JF UTEKAIUX: t I t I 
-, 

/

LINN OPERATING, LLC A/'IgO'>
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:

600 TRAVIS ST., SUITE 140 HOUSTON

4. LOCATION OF \A/ELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

QTRYQTR, SECTION, TOW{SHIP, RANGE, MERIOIAN:

CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

a NOTICE OF INIENT
(Submit in Duplicate)

Approximate date work will start:

tr suBsEouENTREPoRr
(Submit Original Form Only)

Date of work completion:

Linn Operating, lnc. (N4115)
600 Travis St., Suite 1400
Houston, Texas 77002
28'1-8404000

ACIDIZE

ALTER CASING

CASING REPAIR

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS

CHANGE TUBING

CHANGE \A/ELL NAIIE

CHANGE WELL STATUS

COMMINGLE PROOUCING FORMATIONS

CONVERT WELL ryPE

DEEPEN

FRACTURE TREAT

NEWCONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE

PLUG AND ABANDON

PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION (START/RESUME)

RECLAMATION OF I/VELL SITE

RECOMPTETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

SIDETRACK TO REPAIR VI/ELL

TEMPORARILY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR

VENT OR FLARE

WATER DISPOSAL

WATER SHUTOFF

OTHER:

tr
tr
n
a
n
tr
tr
n
tr

n
n
n
u
tr
tr
tr
u

n
tr
tr
u
n
n
n
tr

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective March 1 , 2017 , we respectfully submit for your review a Change of Operator from Linn Operating, lnc. to Linn
Operating, LLC.

Attached is a list of wells that are associated with this Change of Operator. The bonds covering these wells are State of Utah
Surety Bond #K09515367, BIA Bond #B,004292, BLM Bond #K09515124. All lease agreements remain in place, unchanged.

REOEIVED

APR I 1 2o1i

DIV. OF OIL,GAS&MINING

Nancy FitzwaterNAME (PLEASE PRINT)

SIGNATURE

(Thi8 3pac6 for State u3o only)

,rLE RegulatorySupervisor

DArE 41612017

JUN I i 2017

OIt GAS & M]NING
(5/2000) (See lnstructions on Rsvers€ Side)

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached list

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill newwells, significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottomatole depth, reenter plugged wells,or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPEOF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached see attached list
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

LINN OPERATING,LLC N I
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR; PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
600 TRAVISST., SUITE 140 HOUSTON

STATE TX ZIP 77002 (281) 840-4000
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: COUNTY: Duchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

il CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly show all pertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective March 1, 2017, we respectfully submit for your reviewa Change of Operator from Linn Operating, Inc. to Linn
Operating, LLC.

Attached is a list of wells that are associated with this Change of Operator. The bonds covering these wells are State of Utah
Surety Bond #KO9515367,BIA Bond #BOO4292, BLM Bond #KO9515124. All lease agreements remain in place, unchanged.

Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115) RECENED
600 Travis St., Suite 1400
Houston, Texas 77002 AŸR1 Î 2N
281-840-4000

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

min Mc eil
ice President, Sr. Op ations

JUNO 2017
IV.OILGAS &MINING

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached list

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill newwells, significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottomatole depth, reenter plugged wells,or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPEOF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached see attached list
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

LINN OPERATING,LLC N I
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR; PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
600 TRAVISST., SUITE 140 HOUSTON

STATE TX ZIP 77002 (281) 840-4000
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: COUNTY: Duchesne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

il CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart: CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly show all pertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective March 1, 2017, we respectfully submit for your reviewa Change of Operator from Linn Operating, Inc. to Linn
Operating, LLC.

Attached is a list of wells that are associated with this Change of Operator. The bonds covering these wells are State of Utah
Surety Bond #KO9515367,BIA Bond #BOO4292, BLM Bond #KO9515124. All lease agreements remain in place, unchanged.

Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115) RECENED
600 Travis St., Suite 1400
Houston, Texas 77002 AŸR1 Î 2N
281-840-4000

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

min Mc eil
ice President, Sr. Op ations

JUNO 2017
IV.OILGAS &MINING

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATUML RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do rct us€ this form for proposals to ffill new wells, significanfly d6pen elisting wells belon, cureni botom-hote depth, reenter ptugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. UsE APPLICATIoN FoR PEiMIT To oRtLL form for such proposats.

oll WELL ! cAS wELL f] oTHER see attached

5. LEASE DE

see attached list
INDIAN, ALLOTTEE

7. UNIT or CA

TA/ELL t.lAME gnd

see attached list
9. API

AND POOL, OR

AND SERIAL

2. NAME OF

LINN OPERATING, LLC (N4365)
3. ADDRESS OF OPEMTOR:

600 TRAVIS ST., SUITE 140 HOUSTON

4. LOCATION OF VGLL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

QTRYQTR, SECTION, TOW!SHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

couNrY: Duchesne

STATE:

UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES To INDICATE NATURE of rvofrCE, REpORT, oR oTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicats)

Approximate date work will start:

N SUBSEQUENTREPoRT
(Submit Original Form Onty)

Date of work completion:

ACIDIZE

ALTER CASING

CASING REPAIR

cHANGEropREvrous pLANs A
CHANGE TUBING

CHANGE VGLL NAME

CHANGE VVELL STATUS

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

CONVERT\A/ELL ryPE

TYPE OF ACTION

DEEPEN

FMCTURE TREAT

NEWCONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE

PLUG AND ABANDON

PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION (START/RESUME)

RECLAMATION OF \A/ELL SITE

RECOMPLETE . DIFFERENT FORMATION

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

TEMPORARILY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR

VENT OR FLARE

WATER DISPOSAL

WATER SHUT.OFF

OTHER:

n
u
tr
u
D
tr
n

n
n
n

u
tr
D
tr
n

u
tr
tr
n
tr
tr
n
tr
tr

a

12' DESCRIBE PROPoSED OR CoMPLETED OPEMTIONS. Clearly show all pertinent detaits including dates, depths, votumes, etc.

Linn Operating, lnc. (N4115)
600 Travis St., Suite 1400
Houston, Texas 77002
281-8404000

Effective March 1,2017, we respectfully submit for your review a Change of Operator from Linn Operating, lnc. to LinnOperating, LLC.

Attached is a list of surface facilities that are associated with this Change of operator. The bonds covering these facilities areState of Utah Surety Bond #K09515367, BIA Bond #BOo42g2, BLM Bond #Ko'g51s124. All lease agreements remain in place,unchanged.

RECEII/ED

APR 1 r tr.tl
atv. oF aL,6A$* urvffve

NAME (PLEAsE PRrNr Nancy
,,rLE Regulatory Supervisor

SIGNATURE DArE 41612017

JUN I r 20t7

IV. OIL GAS & MINING

(Thls lpaco for Stato $6 only)

(See lnstructiorc on R6verse Side)

STATE OF UTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached list
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells,significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or todrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
hed . 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER see attac

see attached list
2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. API NUMBER:
LINN OPERATING,LLC(N4365)

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL,OR WILDCAT:600 TRAVISST., SUITE 140 HOUSTON
STATE TX ZIP 77002 (281) 840-4000

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
COUNTY: DUCASSne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGE TOPREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE
O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate ofworkcompletion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBEPROPOSEDOR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Effective March 1, 2017, we respectfully submit for your review a Change of Operator from Linn Operating, Inc. to LinnOperating, LLC.

Attached is a list of surface facilities that are associated with thisChange of Operator. The bonds covering these facilities areState of Utah Surety Bond #KO9515367, BIA Bond #BOO4292, BLMBond #KO9515124. AIIlease agreements remain in place,unchanged.

Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115) RECEWED600 Travis St., Suite 1400
Houston, Texas 77002 I 2O281-840-4000

$$kflNING

in McNeil
ice President, Sr. Oper ions

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Nancy Fitzwatet
TITLE RegUISÍOry Supervisor

SIGNATURE
DATE 4/6/2017

(This space for State use only) A PPHuve La
JUN1A2017

IV.OIL GAS&MINING(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached list
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells,significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or todrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL
hed . 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER see attac

see attached list
2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. API NUMBER:
LINN OPERATING,LLC(N4365)

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL,OR WILDCAT:600 TRAVISST., SUITE 140 HOUSTON
STATE TX ZIP 77002 (281) 840-4000

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
COUNTY: DUCASSne

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGE TOPREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE
O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate ofworkcompletion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBEPROPOSEDOR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Effective March 1, 2017, we respectfully submit for your review a Change of Operator from Linn Operating, Inc. to LinnOperating, LLC.

Attached is a list of surface facilities that are associated with thisChange of Operator. The bonds covering these facilities areState of Utah Surety Bond #KO9515367, BIA Bond #BOO4292, BLMBond #KO9515124. AIIlease agreements remain in place,unchanged.

Linn Operating, Inc. (N4115) RECEWED600 Travis St., Suite 1400
Houston, Texas 77002 I 2O281-840-4000

$$kflNING

in McNeil
ice President, Sr. Oper ions

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Nancy Fitzwatet
TITLE RegUISÍOry Supervisor

SIGNATURE
DATE 4/6/2017

(This space for State use only) A PPHuve La
JUN1A2017

IV.OIL GAS&MINING(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



UPpATE ON St WErrS FOR NAME CHANGE

Future Berrv Petroleum Wells

Scofield Thorpe 2241X Rig Skid:
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May L*,20L7.

Scofield Thorpe 35-13
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May Lst,20L7.

Scofield Thorpe 23-gl
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May t*,20L7.

Wilcox Fee 15-16-56
Future Berry Petroleum wel! as of May L*,2017.

LC Fee 8-15D-55
Future Berry Petroleum wellas of May Lst,2Ot7.

CC Fee 7R-28-38
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May L*,2OL7.

Taylor FeeT-14-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May tst,2OL7.

SFW Fee 13-10D-54
Future Berry Petroleum wellas of May Lst,2Ot7.

UNN Enerev Wells

Mark 2-25A2
Received approved LINN Energy budget this month. Repair work under review.

Mitchell24Bt
Received approved LINN Energy budget this month. Repair work under review.

Galloway #2-1,49.2

Reclaim existing pit in Q2 2017. Project delayed due to winter weather.

Hamblin 2-26-A2
Received approved LINN Energy budget this month. Repair work under review.

4ltoltTUPDATEON SI WELLSFOR NAMECHANGE 4/10/17

Future Berry Petroleum Wells

Scofield Thorpe 22-41X Rig Skid:
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1", 2017.

Scofield Thorpe 35-13
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1*, 2017.

Scofield Thorpe 23-31
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1*, 2017.

Wilcox Fee 15-16-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1", 2017.

LCFee 8-15D-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1", 2017.

CCFee 7R-28-38
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1", 2017.

Taylor Fee 7-14-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1'*, 2017.

SFW Fee 13-10D-54
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1'', 2017.

LINNEnergy Wells

Mark 2-25A2
Received approved LINNEnergy budget this month. Repair work under review.

Mitchell 2-4B1
Received approved LINNEnergy budget this month. Repair work under review.

Galloway #2-14B2
Reclaim existing pit in Q2 2017. Project delayed due to winter weather.

Hamblin 2-26-A2
Received approved LINNEnergy budget this month. Repair work under

UPDATEON SI WELLSFOR NAMECHANGE 4/10/17

Future Berry Petroleum Wells

Scofield Thorpe 22-41X Rig Skid:
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1", 2017.

Scofield Thorpe 35-13
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1*, 2017.

Scofield Thorpe 23-31
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1*, 2017.

Wilcox Fee 15-16-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1", 2017.

LCFee 8-15D-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1", 2017.

CCFee 7R-28-38
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1", 2017.

Taylor Fee 7-14-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1'*, 2017.

SFW Fee 13-10D-54
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1'', 2017.

LINNEnergy Wells

Mark 2-25A2
Received approved LINNEnergy budget this month. Repair work under review.

Mitchell 2-4B1
Received approved LINNEnergy budget this month. Repair work under review.

Galloway #2-14B2
Reclaim existing pit in Q2 2017. Project delayed due to winter weather.

Hamblin 2-26-A2
Received approved LINNEnergy budget this month. Repair work under



STATE OF UTAH SHUT tN LIST ESTTMATED p/A COSTS 4ltol2ot7

WELLNAME

Scofield Thorpe 22-4tX Rig Skid

Scofield Thorpe 35-13

Scofield Thorpe 23-31

SFW Fee 13-10D-54

Wilcox Fee 15-16-56

LC Fee 8-15D-56

CC Fee 7R-28-38

Tavlor Fee 7-14-56

Mark 2-25A2

Mitchell2-481
Galloway 2-L482
Hamblin 2-26A2

FUTURE OPERATOR

Berry Petroleum Company
Berry Petroleum Company
Berry Petroleum Company
Berry Petroleum Company

Berry Petroleum Company

Berry Petroleum Company

Berry Petroleum Company
Petroleum Com

Berry Petroleum Company TOTAL

LINN Operating
LINN Operating
LINN Operating
LINN

LINN Operating TOTAL

ESTIMATED P/A COSTS

45,000

45,0@
45,000

35,000

35,000

35,000

75,000

350,(x,0

75,000

75,000

30,000

75,000

255,0(x1

s
s
s
s
S

s
s
s

s
5

s
s

LINN
STATE OF UTAHSHUT IN LISTESTIMATED P/A COSTS 4/10/2017

Energy

WELLNAME FUTURE OPERATOR ESTIMATEDP/A COSTS
Scofield Thorpe 22-41X Rig Skid Berry Petroleum Company $ 45,000
Scofield Thorpe 35-13 Berry Petroleum Company $ 45,000
Scofield Thorpe 23-31 Berry Petroleum Company $ 45,000
SFW Fee 13-10D-54 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000
Wilcox Fee 15-16-56 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000
LCFee 8-15D-56 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000
CCFee 7R-28-38 Berry Petroleum Company $ 75,000
Taylor Fee 7-14-56 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000

Berry Petroleum Company TOTAL $ 350,000

Mark 2-25A2 LINNOperating $ 75,000
Mitchell 2-4B1 LINN Operating $ 75,000
Galloway 2-14B2 LINNOperating $ 30,000
Hamblin 2-26A2 LINNOperating $ 75,000

LINN Operating TOTAL $

LINN
STATE OF UTAHSHUT IN LISTESTIMATED P/A COSTS 4/10/2017

Energy

WELLNAME FUTURE OPERATOR ESTIMATEDP/A COSTS
Scofield Thorpe 22-41X Rig Skid Berry Petroleum Company $ 45,000
Scofield Thorpe 35-13 Berry Petroleum Company $ 45,000
Scofield Thorpe 23-31 Berry Petroleum Company $ 45,000
SFW Fee 13-10D-54 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000
Wilcox Fee 15-16-56 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000
LCFee 8-15D-56 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000
CCFee 7R-28-38 Berry Petroleum Company $ 75,000
Taylor Fee 7-14-56 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000

Berry Petroleum Company TOTAL $ 350,000

Mark 2-25A2 LINNOperating $ 75,000
Mitchell 2-4B1 LINN Operating $ 75,000
Galloway 2-14B2 LINNOperating $ 30,000
Hamblin 2-26A2 LINNOperating $ 75,000

LINN Operating TOTAL $



4rzrn17 Shte cf Uhh Mail - Unn Name Change and Berry Opeator Ctnnge

Rachel Medi na <rachelmedi na@utah. gov>

Linn Name Ghange and Berry Operator Ghange
2 messages

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov> Thu, Apr 20,201T at 11:58 AM
To: Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>, Randy Thackeray <randythackeray@utah.gov>

Dustin,

Linn is planning on moving all the wells from Linn Inc. to Linn LLC, then complete an operator change for the Berry wells.
Eight of the wells on the non+ompliance list will be move to Berry. Are you okay with us moving all the wells to Berry,
putting the eight wells on the blanket bond, then getting the shut in plans and full cost bond when the move to Berry is
complete?

The blanket bond and full cost bonding for the Linn wells will of course be in place before we complete the move.

Attached is the plugging estimates for all twelve wells, as well as a list of which wells are going to the new Linn and
Berry. They have some details on what they plan to do with the wells on the Update list. Will this be acceptable for a
shut in plan and plugging estimates?

Rachel Medina
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Bonding Technician
801-53&5260

2017U20110137.pdf
58K

Dusti n Doucet <dustindoucet@utah. gov>
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>
Cc: Randy Thackeray <randythackeray@utah. gov>

l'm o.k. with those amounts. They should send in their plans for the wells.
[Quoted text hidden]

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
801.538.5281 (ofc)
801.359.3940 (fax)

web: www.ogm.utah.gov

Thu, Apr 27,2017 at 10:40 AM

htFs//mail.google.corn/mail/calry'1l?ui=2&ik=72fde6<l6acItview=d&ssctr=inbo<&th=15bb01906b345091&siml=15lr8c83b8ti33fc83&dml=15bbo4906t€45094

4/27/2017 State ofUtah Mail - LinnName Change and Berry Operator Change

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Linn Name Change and Berry Operator Change
2 messages

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov> Thu, Apr 20, 2017 at 11:58 AM
To: Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>, Randy Thackeray <randythackeray@utah.gov>

Dustin,

Linn is planning on movingall the wells from Linn Inc. to Linn LLC,then complete an operator change for the Berry wells.
Eight of the wells on the non-compliance list will be move to Berry. Are you okay with us movingall the wells to Berry,
putting the eight wells on the blanket bond, thengetting the shut in plans and full cost bond when the move to Berry is
complete?

The blanket bond and full cost bonding for the Linn wells willof course be in place before we complete the move.

Attached is the plugging estimates for all twelvewells, as we11as a list of which wells are going to the new Linn and
Berry. They have some details on what they plan to do with the wells on the Update list. Will this be acceptable for a
shut in plan and plugging estimates?

Rachel Medina
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Bonding Technician
801-538-5260

20170420110137.pdf
58K

Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov> Thu, Apr 27, 2017 at 10:40 AM
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Cc: Randy Thackeray <randythackeray@utah.gov>

l'm o.k. with those amounts. They should send in theirplans for the wells.
[Quoted text hidden]

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
801.538.5281 (ofc)
801.359.3940 (fax)

web: www.ogm.utah.gov

https://mail.google.com/maillcalu/1/?ui=2&ik=72fde6d6ad&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15m siml=15b8c83b8833fc83&siml=15bb04906b345094

4/27/2017 State ofUtah Mail - LinnName Change and Berry Operator Change

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Linn Name Change and Berry Operator Change
2 messages

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov> Thu, Apr 20, 2017 at 11:58 AM
To: Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>, Randy Thackeray <randythackeray@utah.gov>

Dustin,

Linn is planning on movingall the wells from Linn Inc. to Linn LLC,then complete an operator change for the Berry wells.
Eight of the wells on the non-compliance list will be move to Berry. Are you okay with us movingall the wells to Berry,
putting the eight wells on the blanket bond, thengetting the shut in plans and full cost bond when the move to Berry is
complete?

The blanket bond and full cost bonding for the Linn wells willof course be in place before we complete the move.

Attached is the plugging estimates for all twelvewells, as we11as a list of which wells are going to the new Linn and
Berry. They have some details on what they plan to do with the wells on the Update list. Will this be acceptable for a
shut in plan and plugging estimates?

Rachel Medina
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Bonding Technician
801-538-5260

20170420110137.pdf
58K

Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov> Thu, Apr 27, 2017 at 10:40 AM
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Cc: Randy Thackeray <randythackeray@utah.gov>

l'm o.k. with those amounts. They should send in theirplans for the wells.
[Quoted text hidden]

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
801.538.5281 (ofc)
801.359.3940 (fax)

web: www.ogm.utah.gov

https://mail.google.com/maillcalu/1/?ui=2&ik=72fde6d6ad&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15m siml=15b8c83b8833fc83&siml=15bb04906b345094



600 Tnevrs. Sune 1400
Housror, TX77002

PHoNE: (281) 840-4000
rex: (281) 840-4001

May 25, 2017

Mr. Dustin Doucet

State of Utah - DNR

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

Re: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases

Four (4) Fee Lease Wells (see attachment A)

Dear Mr. Doucet:

ln response to your request for more detailed six (5) month plans, Linn respectfully submits the
following plans to bring these wells into compliance:

Mark2-25A2
Plan to P/A this well. A sundry will be submitted in June 2017 and the P/A work will be completed by
September 30,2017.

Mitchell2-4Bt
Plan to return well to production. This repair work will be completed by June 30,2017.

Galloway #2-t482
The existing pit will be reclaimed in May 2017. We are requesting a T/A extension through December
2018 on this well to maintain the constructed surface location and surface pipe. This will allow for
review of results from planned horizontal drilling this year to provide a detailed plan for this wellbore.

Hamblin 2-26-A2
Plan to P/A this well. A sundry will be submitted in June 2AL7 and the P/A work will be completed by
September 30,20L7.

Linn appreciates your time and consideration. lf you require any additional information please do not
hesitate to contact me at 281-840-4266 or by e-mail at nfitzwater@linnenergy.com.

MAY 3 0 zoi
D,y. oF o,L, GAs & fu,N,NG

LINN OPERATING, LLC

{)arat
Nancy ri/zwaterff
Regulatory Supelvi(or

4,(*c,4

600 TRAvis. Sunt1400
HOUSTON, TX 77002

PHONE: (281) 840-4000
FAx: (281) 840-4001

RECEIVED
May 25, 2017

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

Mr. Dustin Doucet
State of Utah - DNR
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

Re: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases
Four (4) Fee Lease Wells (see attachment A)

Dear Mr. Doucet:

In response to your request for more detailed six (6) month plans, Linn respectfully submits the
following plans to bring these wells into compliance:

Mark 2-25A2
Plan to P/A this well. A sundry will be submitted in June 2017 and the P/A work will be completed by
September 30, 2017.

Mitchell 2-4B1
Plan to return well to production. This repair work will be completed by June 30, 2017.

Galloway #2-14B2
The existing pit will be reclaimed in May 2017. We are requesting a T/A extension through December
2018 on this well to maintain the constructed surface location and surface pipe. This will allow for
review of results from planned horizontal drillingthis year to provide a detailed plan for this wellbore.

Hamblin 2-26-A2
Plan to P/A this well. A sundry will be submitted in June 2017 and the P/A work will be completed by
September 30, 2017.

Linn appreciates your time and consideration. If you require any additional information please do not
hesitate to contact me at 281-840-4266 or by e-mail at nfitzwater@linnenergy.com.

LINNOPERATING,LLC

Nancy Fi zwate
Regulatory Supe

600 TRAvis. Sunt1400
HOUSTON, TX 77002

PHONE: (281) 840-4000
FAx: (281) 840-4001

RECEIVED
May 25, 2017

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

Mr. Dustin Doucet
State of Utah - DNR
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

Re: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases
Four (4) Fee Lease Wells (see attachment A)

Dear Mr. Doucet:

In response to your request for more detailed six (6) month plans, Linn respectfully submits the
following plans to bring these wells into compliance:

Mark 2-25A2
Plan to P/A this well. A sundry will be submitted in June 2017 and the P/A work will be completed by
September 30, 2017.

Mitchell 2-4B1
Plan to return well to production. This repair work will be completed by June 30, 2017.

Galloway #2-14B2
The existing pit will be reclaimed in May 2017. We are requesting a T/A extension through December
2018 on this well to maintain the constructed surface location and surface pipe. This will allow for
review of results from planned horizontal drillingthis year to provide a detailed plan for this wellbore.

Hamblin 2-26-A2
Plan to P/A this well. A sundry will be submitted in June 2017 and the P/A work will be completed by
September 30, 2017.

Linn appreciates your time and consideration. If you require any additional information please do not
hesitate to contact me at 281-840-4266 or by e-mail at nfitzwater@linnenergy.com.

LINNOPERATING,LLC

Nancy Fi zwate
Regulatory Supe



State of Utah Mail - Linn's Shut-ln Plan6/5m17

Linn's Shut-ln PIan
2 messages

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Rachel Medi na <rachelmedina@utah. gov>
To: Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Hi Dustin,

Attached is the shut in plan that Linn has for the four wells they will be keeping. ls
Linn, lnc, to Linn, LLC operator change?

Rachel Medina
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Bonding Technician
801-538-s260

B 33lr*2oeo5o8.pdf

Fri, Jun 2,2017 at 9:56 AM

this enough for me to complete the

Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah. gov>

Looks good.

[Quoted text hidden]

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
801.538.5281 (ofc)
801.359.3940 (fax)

web: www.ogm.utah.gov

Mon, Jun 5,2017 at 11:26 AM

https://mail.google.corn/mail/celr./0Pui=2&ik=72fde6d6ad{tvisw=pt&search=fash&th=15c7950f38bd0171&siml=15c69861a8202dc7&siml=1*7Mtu7@.

6/5/2017 State of Utah Mail - Linn's Shut-In Plan

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Linn's Shut-In Plan
2 messages

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov> Fri, Jun 2, 2017 at 9:56 AM
To: Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Hi Dustin,

Attached is the shut in plan that Linn has for the four wells they will be keeping. Is this enough for me to complete the
Linn, Inc, to Linn, LLCoperator change?

Rachel Medina
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Bonding Technician
801-538-5260

20170602090508.pdf
56K

Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov> Mon, Jun 5, 2017 at 11:26 AM
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Looks good.
[Quoted text hidden]

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
801.538.5281 (ofc)
801.359.3940 (fax)

web: www.ogm.utah.gov

https://mail.google.com/maillcalu/0/?ui=2&ik=72fde6d6ad&view=pt&search=trash&th=15c7950138bd0171&siml=15c69861a8202dc7&siml=15c794b4616c7d22

6/5/2017 State of Utah Mail - Linn's Shut-In Plan

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Linn's Shut-In Plan
2 messages

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov> Fri, Jun 2, 2017 at 9:56 AM
To: Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Hi Dustin,

Attached is the shut in plan that Linn has for the four wells they will be keeping. Is this enough for me to complete the
Linn, Inc, to Linn, LLCoperator change?

Rachel Medina
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Bonding Technician
801-538-5260

20170602090508.pdf
56K

Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov> Mon, Jun 5, 2017 at 11:26 AM
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Looks good.
[Quoted text hidden]

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
801.538.5281 (ofc)
801.359.3940 (fax)

web: www.ogm.utah.gov

https://mail.google.com/maillcalu/0/?ui=2&ik=72fde6d6ad&view=pt&search=trash&th=15c7950138bd0171&siml=15c69861a8202dc7&siml=15c794b4616c7d22



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 5lt/2017
FOR]VIf,R OPERATOR: NETilOPERATOR:
Linn Operating,LLC
600 Travis Street, Suite 1400

Houston, T)(77002

Berry Petroleum Company, LLc
5201 Truztun Avenue
Bakersfield, CA 93309

CANumber(s): tlti{s}: tsniiffi Cryqn,BemvPi{otp^0ff.&nm&ne,Cri rr

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entitv Mineral Surface fvpe Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CIIANGES DOCUMENTATION:
L Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on:
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on:
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: WfFi!4ir-Ot6l

REVIEW:
l. Surface Agreement Sundry from I\EW operator on Fee Surface wells received on:
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on:
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries:
4. OPS/SVTA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding:
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on:
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change:

LinnEugr,IJ.C{asPhdt

7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request):

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s):

6#r.tg.sr1
4rx2f?6t7
,pmmni*t

4ftWhV
ery}&,t7

qnLWilit
ffiilfz&y[.:

Allb6*dpd

Bsl053&Btuiket,
B&lWgqi . :,'
8$1ffi29: l

80tO628,. , :',

&t:06?fi ::"'

B$10635 ,,' t':t:,,

mrs62d '
801623

DATA ENTRY:
l. Well(s) update in the RBDMS on:
2. Group(s) update in RDBMS on:

3. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on:

6/nw[x
6n7/2017
6/29tm.r1

COMMENTS:

6/29/2OL7

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 5/1/2017
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Linn Operating, LLC Berry Petroleum Company, LLc
600 Travis Street, Suite 1400 5201 Truztun Avenue
Houston, TX 77002 Bakersfield, CA 93309

CA Number(s): Unit(s): Bradford Canyon, Berry Pilot EOR,.BrundageCanyon

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name See TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/21/2017
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/21/2017
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 9783541-0161

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 4/21/2017
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: 4/21/2017
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/27/2017
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 4/22/2017
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: 5/25/2017
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: Section23

section22
Section 21
Davis Hollow :

scofield
Section 14
Ute Pipeline
Ute Pipeline 21
Ute Pipeline 7
Skitzy
Lina Energy, LLC-<iasPlant

7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): All bonded

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): B010538-Blanket

BOl0630
B010629
B010628
B010627
B010626
8010625
BOl0624
B010623

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the RBDMS on: 6/27/2017
2. Group(s) update in RDBMS on: 6/27/2017
3. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 6/29/2017

COMMENTS:



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF MTURAT RESOURCES

D]VISION OF OIL. GASAND MINING

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WEULS
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Attached is a list of surfacs facilities that are associsted with this Change of Operator.
state of utah surety Bord #B010s38, BtA Bond #B010seo, alla a;o *aotosao.

Linn Operating, LLC (N436S)
600 Travis St., Sulte 1400
Houston, Texas 77002
281-M04000

corrililGt c PROOITC|NG FORilATTONS

COl\n,ER? TTET! TVPE

u
E]
tr
tr
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tr

Effecuve May 1, ?o17 , we resPegtfully submit for your review a change pf operator hom Llnn operaung, LLC (N4365) to BerryPatrdeum Company, LLC (N407S). 
-

The bonds oovering hese facilities are

RHOEIVED

APR 21 2l''17

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MININ(
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STATE OF UTAH FORM9DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GASANDMINING S LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUM6ER;

see attached list
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIGENAME

7 UNir er CA AGREEMENTNAMEDonotuse thisform for proposals to drillnew web, signilicantlydeepen existingweis below currentboltamumle , reenterpksged weis, ortodra horizonial laterab. Use APPUCATION FOR PERMITTOORILLfann for such .

1 TYPEOF WEM.
OILWELL O GASWELL O OTHERsee attache 0 WELLNAMEandNUMBER

see attached list2 NAMEOF OPERATOR
9 API NUMBERBERRY PETROLEUMCOMPANY,LLC

3 ADDRESSOPOPERATOR PHONENUMBER 90 FIELOANDPOOL, OR WILOCAT5201 TRUXTUNAVENUE BAKERSFIELD CA 93309 (661) 616-3900
4 LOCATIONOFWELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE
COUNTY DUCheSne

OTRIOTR. SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGEMER©lAN STATE
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE F NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION T E OF ACTION

O acea O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENTFORMATIONNOTICEOF INTENT
(Submitin Duplicate) O mena c^••• O FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTOREPAIR WELL

Approximeta date work we siart O CASING REPAIN O -cons nue- O TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETOPREWOUSANIS OPERATORCNANGE TUBWGREPAR

O CHANGETUBING O AUG ANDABANDON O VENTORRAREO SUBSEQUENTREPORT 0 CMGE WELLME O PLUGBACM O MTER DEPO6AL(SubmitOriginalForm Only)
O CHANGEWELLSTATUS O anoouca (STARTIRESUME) MHR HUT-OFFDato ofwalk compielm

O COMMWGLEPRODUCMG FOMONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER
O CONVERTWELLTYPE O MCOMP - DIFFERENT FORMABON

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS Clearlyshowallpertinent details dates depihe volumes. elc.
Effective May 1, 2017, we respectfullysubmitfor your review a Change iOperator from Linn Operating, LLC(N4365) to BerryPetroleum Company, LLC(N4075).

Attached is a list of surface facilities that are associated with this Change of Operator. The bonds coveringthese facilities areState of Utah Surety Bond #B010538, BIABond #8010546, BLMBond #BO10580.
RECElVEDLinn Operating,LLC(N4365)

600 Travis St., Suite 1400 þÿR2 1 ?O/Houston, Texas 77002
281-840-4000

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&M\NING

I
President, Sr. rations

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) ROVS MSo CFO

(1Ms space for State use only)

JUN2 7 2017
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(st2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)



From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effective:Mav 1.2017

6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
Well Name API Town Twp Dir Range Rng Dir Sec Entity Number Well Type Well Status
Z and T UTE TRIBAL2-21 4301331280 5 S 4 W 21 _ 11130 Water Injection Well Active
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 10-21 4301331283 5 S 4 W 21 11133 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 16-21-54 4301332381 5 S 4 W 21 13912 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 7-21-54 4301332623 5 S 4 W 21 14383 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 12-30-54 4301332747 5 S 4 W 30 14747 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 14-30-54 4301332748 5 S 4 W 30 14778 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 10-30D-54 4301332893 5 S 4 W 30 15246 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL6-30-54 4301332975 5 S 4 W 30 15300 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 9-21-54 4301333040 5 S 4 W 21 15360 Water injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-54 4301333114 5 S 4 W 21 15441 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 1-21-54 4301333388 5 S 4 W 21 15937 Water Injection Well Active
UTE TRIBAL 15-28D-55 4301333623 5 S 5 W 28 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13H-9-56 4301350874 5 S 6 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL4H-26-56 4301350951 5 S 6 W 26 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5H-34-45 4301350974 4 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 11-34-45 4301350975 4 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Approved Permit
CC TRIBAL4-30D-38 4301350993 3 S 8 W 19 Oil Well Approved Permit
FEDERAL 4-1-65 4301351016 6 S 5 W 1 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13H-28-45 4301351061 4 S 5 W 28 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5H-23-45 4301351071 4 S 5 W 23 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 4H-27-45 4301351072 4 S 5 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 16-27-45 4301351074 4 S 5 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 12-27-45 4301351075 4 S 5 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 16-23-45 4301351077 4 S 5 W 23 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 12H-30-56 4301351133 5 S 6 W 30 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5H-33-45 4301351338 4 S 5 W 33 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL6-16D-56 4301351406 5 S 6 W 16 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 3-14D-56 4301351408 5 S 6 W 14 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-6D-57 4301351417 5 S 7 W 6 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-23-45 4301351432 4 S 5 W 23 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5-28D-56 4301351441 5 S 6 W 29 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 15-20D-56 4301351443 5 S 6 W 29 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 16-33-45 4301351463 4 S 5 W 33 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL7-23D-56 4301351479 5 S 6 W 23 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL4-7-56 4301351482 5 S 6 W 7 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 3-2-56 4301351483 5 S 6 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
CC TRIBAL 15-34D-38 4301351490 4 S 8 W 2 Oil Well Aggroved Permit
CC TRIBAL 14-35D-38 4301351491 4 S 8 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
CC TRIBAL 8-3D-48 4301351493 4 S 8 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-10D-56 4301351510 5 S 6 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 3-10D-56 4301351511 5 S 6 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL7-10D-56 4301351512 5 S 6 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-29D-56 4301351513 5 S 6 W 29 Oil Well Approved Permit
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL 1-16-55 4301351519 5 S 5 W 16 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-17-56 4301351704 5 S 6 W 17 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 4HW-8-56 _ 4301351710 5 S 6 W 8 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL3-11D-56 _ 4301351713 5 S 6 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL7-11D-56 4301351714 5 S 6 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-34D-45 4301351717 4 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL4-34D-45 4301351723 4 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 7-34D-45 4301351724 4 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-34D-45 4301351747 4 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 12-31D-56 4301351799 5 S 6 W 31 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL8-20D-56 4301351800 5 S 6 W 20 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL6-31D-56 4301351801 5 S 6 W 31 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 11-7D-57 4301351814 5 S 7 W 7 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 5-7D-57 4301351815 5 S 7 W 7 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 11-6D-57 4301351817 5 S 7 W 6 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 8-33-45 4301351859 4 S 5 W 33 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 7-23D-45 430951865 4 S 5 W 23 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 1-23D-56 4301351866 5 S 6 W 23 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-19-56 4301351867 5 S 6 W 19 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL7-19D-56 4301351868 5 S 6 W 19 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-4D-56 4301351869 5 S 6 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 14-32D-45 4301351879 4 S 5 W 32 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL7-17D-56 4301351886 5 S 6 W 17 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL5-17D-56 4301351887 5 S 6 W 17 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-2D-56 4301351893 5 S 6 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRÏBAL 1-2D-56 4301351894 5 S 6 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 15-23D-45 4301351895 4 S 5 W 23 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 11-34D-56 4301351900 5 S 6 W 34 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-5D-56 4301351901 5 S 6 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-28D-45 4301351903 4 S 5 W 28 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-20D-56 4301351904 5 S 6 W 20 Oil Wen Approved Permit
Ute Tribal 14-17-55 4301351908 5 S 5 W 17 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 14-7D-65 4301351910 5 S 6 W 31 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 3-27D-45 _ 4301351911 4 S 5 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-34D-56 4301351914 5 S 6 W 34 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-33D-45 4301351939 4 S 5 W 33 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 14-33D-45 4301351940 4 S 5 W 33 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-27D-45 4301351941 4 S 5 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 14-27D-45 4301351951 4 S 5 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 6-33D-45 4301351955 4 S 5 W 33 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 6-32D-45 4301351956 4 S 5 W 32 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 3-11D-65 4301351982 6 S 5 W 11 Oil Well _ Approved Permit
Federal 2-4-64 4301351983 6 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 5-11D-65 4301351984 6 S 5 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

6t27t2017

rom: Linn Operating, LLC
o: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

¯ffective:May 1, 2017
Federal 7-4D-64 4301351985 6 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 3-4D-64 4301351986 6 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 8-4D-64 4301351988 6 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 6-4D-64 4301351989 6 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 4-4D-64 4301351991 6 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 9-4D-64 4301352004 6 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 10-4D-64 4301352011 6 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 1-4D-64 4301352025 6 S 4 W 4 OilWell Approved Permit
Federal 16-4D-64 4301352026 6 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-23D-45 4301352029 4 S 5 W 23 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 15-4D-64 4301352032 6 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 9-9D-64 4301352036 6 S 4 W 9 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 10-9D-64 4301352041 6 S 4 W 9 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 15-9D-64 4301352043 6 S 4 W 9 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 16-9D-64 4301352044 6 S 4 W 9 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 10-32D-45 4301352065 4 S 5 W 32 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 16-28D-45 4301352073 4 S 5 W 28 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 15-24D-45 4301352074 4 S 5 W 24 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 13-17D-56 4301352076 5 S 6 W 17 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 15-17D-56 4301352077 5 S 6 W 17 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 5-26D-56 4301352097 5 S 6 W 26 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 11-26D-56 4301352098 5 S 6 W 26 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 4-9D-56 4301352102 5 S 6 W 9 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Tribal 8-32D-45 4301352135 4 S 5 W 32 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 15-24D-54 4301352156 5 S 4 W 24 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 9-24D-54 4301352157 5 S 4 W 24 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 1-25D-54 4301352173 5 S 4 W 25 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 9-25D-54 4301352177 5 S 4 W 25 Gas Well ÄpprovedPermit
MyrinTribal 9-10D-55 4301352189 5 S 5 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
MyrinTribal 16-10D-55 4301352190 5 S 5 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
MyrinTribal 10-10D-55 4301352191 5 S 5 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 1-24D-54 4301352304 5 S 4 W 24 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 7-24D-54 4301352306 5 S 4 W 24 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 12-25D-54 4301352308 5 S 4 W 25 Gas Well A roved PermitPP
UTE Tribal 4-13D-54 4301352321 5 S 4 W 13 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 13-25D-54 4301352322 5 S 4 W 25 Gas Well A roved PermitPP
UTE Tribal 3-24D-54 4301352347 5 S 4 W 24 Gas Well Approved Permit
UTE Tribal 5-24D-54 4301352348 5 S 4 W 24 Gas Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 14-1D-55 4301352372 5 S 5 W 1 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 11-1D-55 4301352373 5 S 5 W 1 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 13-1D-55 4301352374 5 S 5 W 1 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tiibal 12-2D-55 4301352391 5 S 5 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 14-2D-55 4301352392 5 S 5 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 13-2D-55 4301352393 5 S 5 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Ifective:May 1, 2017
State Tribal 14-3D-55 4301352430 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 11-3D-55 4301352434 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 13-3D-55 4301352435 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL2-5D-55 4301352450 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Approved Permit
Ute Tribal 1-5D-55 4301352456 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Approved Permit
Ute Tribal 7-5-55 4301352459 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Approved Permit
Ute Tribal 3-16D-54 4301352467 5 S 4 W 9 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 1-3D-55 4301352471 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 2-3D-55 4301352472 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 7-3D-55 4301352473 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 8-3D-55 _ 4301352474 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Aggroved Permit
Ute Tribal 2-16D-54 4301352481 5 S 4 W 9 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 3-3D-55 4301352532 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 4-3D-55 4301352533 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 5-3D-55 4301352535 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 6-3D-55 4301352536 5 S 5 VV 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 15-12D-55 4301352549 5 S 5 W 12 Oil Well Approved Permit
Ute Tribal 9-11D-55 4301352564 5 S 5 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 10-11D-55 4301352566 5 S 5 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 15-11D-55 4301352567 5 S 5 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTETTRIELAL14-12D-55 4301352592 5 S 5 VV 12 OilVVell Approved Pennit
UTE TRIBAL 13-12D-55 4301352593 5 S 5 W 12 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TTilELAL10-11D-54 4301352603 5 S 4 VV 11 OilVVell Approved Pernlit
UTETRIBAL9-11D-54 4301352604 5 S 4 VV 11 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTETRIllAL 15-11-54 4301352605 5 S 4 VV 11 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTEilillELAL16-110-54 4301352606 5 S 4 VV 11 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTETRIllAL 14-11D-55 4301352610 5 S 5 VV 11 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 13-11D-55 4301352611 5 S 5 W 11 Oil VVell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 12-11D-55 4301352612 5 S 5 W 11 Oil VVell Approved Permit
lJTE TRIBAL 11-11D-55 4301352613 5 S 5 VV 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 6-7D-65 4301352682 6 S 5 W 7 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 11-7D-65 _ 4301352683 6 S 5 VV 7 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal10-7D-65 4301352684 6 S 5 VV 7 OilVVell Approved Pennit
Federal 7-7D-65 4301352685 6 S 5 VV 7 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL4-17D-55 4301352695 5 S 5 VV 17 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 14-13D-54 4301352702 5 S 4 W 13 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 3-11D-55 4301352704 5 S 5 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 4-11D-55 4301352705 5 S 5 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
SitahaTribal5-11D-55 4301352706 5 S 5 VV 11 OilVVell Approved Permit
SitahaTribal6-11D-55 4301352707 5 S 5 VV 11 OilVVell Approved Pennit
State Tribal 8-11D-55 4301352708 5 S 5 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 7-11D-55 4301352709 5 S 5 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 2-11D-55 4301352710 5 S 5 W 11 Oil Well Approved Permit
StateTribal1-11D-55 4301352711 5 S 5 VV 11 OilVVell Approved Pennit
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
o: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

¯ñective:May 1,2017
UTE TRIBAL9-4D-55 4301352713 5 S 5 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 2-10D-55 4301352714 5 S 5 IW 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 7-10D-55 4301352715 5 S 5 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 8-10D-55 _ 4301352716 5 S 5 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 10-4D-55 4301352717 5 S 5 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 15-4D-55 4301352718 5 S 5 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 1-10D-55 4301352720 5 S 5 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 16-4D-55 4301352721 5 S 5 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 3-10D-55 4301352723 5 S 5 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 4-10D-55 4301352724 5 S 5 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 5-10D-55 4301352725 5 S 5 W 10 Oil Well Approved Permit
StateTribal6-10D-55 4301352726 5 S 5 VV 10 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 11-5D-55 4301352727 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 12-5D-55 4301352728 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-55 4301352729 5 S 5 VV 5 _ Oil Well Aggroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 14-5D-55 4301352730 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 15-2D-55 4301352732 5 S 5 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 16-2D-55 4301352733 5 S 5 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 9-2D-55 4301352735 5 S 5 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 16-30D-55 4301352738 5 S 5 W 30 Oil Well Approved Permit
MyrinTribal 9-19D-55 4301352739 5 S 5 W 19 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 16-3D-55 4301352740 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 15-3D-55 4301352741 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 10-3D-55 4301352742 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
State Tribal 9-3D-55 4301352743 5 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
MyrinTribal15-19D-55 4301352744 5 S 5 VV 19 OilVVell Approved Permit
MyrinTribal 13-19D-55 4301352745 5 S 5 W 19 Oil Well Approved Permit
MyrinTribal 12-19D-55 4301352746 5 S 5 W 19 Oil VVelt Aggroved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 5-4D-55 4301352747 5 S 5 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL4-4D-55 4301352748 5 S 5 VW 4 Oil VVell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL3-4D-55 4301352749 5 S 5 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL6-4D-55 4301352754 5 S 5 W 4 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 7-31D-55 4301352764 5 S 5 VV 31 Oil Well Approved Permit
MyrinTribal 11-19D-55 4301352765 5 S 5 W 19 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL4-30D-55 4301352796 5 S 5 W 30 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 5-30D-55 4301352797 5 S 5 W 30 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL7-30D-55 4301352799 5 S 5 W 30 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 1-30D-55 4301352809 5 S 5 W 30 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL6-25D-56 4301352810 5 S 6 W 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL4-25D-56 4301352812 5 S 6 VV 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 6-13D-65 9013528136 S 5 W 13 Oil Well

_

Approved Permit
Federal 4-13D-65 4301352814 6 S 5 W 13 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal3-13D-65 4301352815 6 S 5 VV 13 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal3-16D-B4 4301352823 6 S 4 VV 16 OilVVell Approved Permit
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

:Mav 1.2017

6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
·ñective:May 1,2017
Federal4-16D-64 4301352824 6 S 4 VV 16 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal5-16D-64 4301352825 6 S 4 VV 16 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal 6-16D-64 |4301352826 6 S 4 W 16 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal5-13D-65 4301352827 6 S 5 VV 13 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-25D-56 4301352835 5 S 6 W 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL2-25D-56 4301352836 5 S 6 W 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL8-25D-56 4301352837 5 S 6 W 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 9-25D-56 4301352840 5 S 6 VV 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 15-25-56 4301352844 5 S 6 W 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 9-5D-65 4301352846 6 S 5 VV 5 Oil Welj Approved Permit
Federal 10-5D-65 4301352847 6 S 5 VV 5 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 16-25D-56 4301352848 5 S 6 VV 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 10-25D-56 4301352849 5 S 6 VV 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL8-30D-55 4301352855 5 S 5 W 29 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL9-29D-55 4301352870 5 S 5 W 29 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL6-24D-55 4301352871 5 S 5 W 24 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 16-17D-55 4301352872 5 S 5 VV 17 OilVVell Approved Permit
Federal 9-8D-64 4301352880 6 S 4 W 9 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal16-8D-64 4301352881 6 S 4 VV 9 OilVVell Approved Pernlit
LTEETTilELAL13-27D-55 4301352882 5 S 5 VV 27 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL4-29D-55 4301352883 5 S 5 W 29 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 1-29D-55 4301352884 5 S 5 W 29 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 4-2D-65 4301352885 6 S 5 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 5-2D-65 4301352886 6 S 5 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 12-2D-65 4301352887 6 S 5 W 2 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 12-25D-56 4301352888 5 S 6 W 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-25D-56 4301352890 5 S 6 W 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 14-25D-56 4301352891 5 S 6 W 25 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 15-3D-65 4301352892 6 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 9-3D-65 4301352893 6 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 8-3D-65 _ 4301352894 6 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal 6-3D-65 4301352895 6 S 5 W 3 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 6-33D-56 4301352896 5 S 6 VV 33 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 2-33D-56 4301352897 5 S 6 W 33 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 4-33D-56 4301352898 5 S 6 W 33 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 5-33D-56 4301352899 5 S 6 VV 33 ÒilWell Approved Permit
UTE FEE 13-9D-54 4301352906 5 S 4 W 9 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE FEE 2-34D-55 4301352971 5 S 5 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
Federal13-7D-ß5 4301352974 6 S 5 VV 7 OilVVell Approved Perrnit
Federal 14-7D-65 4301352975 6 S 5 W 7 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL6-27D-55 4301352976 5 S 5 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 12-27D-56 4301352977 5 S 6 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 13-27D-56 4301352978 5 S 6 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Tribal 16-28D-56 4301352979 5 S 6 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Efective:May1,2017
LC Nielsen Fee 9-28D-56 4301352980 5 S 6 W 27 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC FEE 9-36D-56 _ 4301352982 5 S 6 W 36 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC FEE 15-36D-56 4301352983 5 S 6 W 36 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 6-36D-56 4301352984 5 S 6 W 36 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5-36D-56 4301352985 5 S 6 W 36 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL4-36D-56 4301352986 5 S 6 W 36 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC11RIELAL3-36D-56 4301352987 5 S 6 VV 36 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL2-35D-56 4301352988 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 1-35D-56 4301352989 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL9-35D-56 901353018 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL6-35D-56 4301353019 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 10-35D-56 4301353020 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL9-17D-55 4301353022 5 S 5 W 17 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 8-35D-56 4301353023 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 10-17D-55 4301353024 5 S 5 W 17 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 7-35D-56 4301353025 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 5-35D-56 4301353026 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 15-35D-56 4301353027 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 16-35D-56 4301353028 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL3-35D-56 4301353029 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL4-35D-56 4301353030 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 14-35D-56 4301353036 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 13-35D-56 4301353038 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC TRIBAL 12-35D-56 4301353039 5 S 6 W 35 Oil Well Approved Permit
LCTTRIELAL11-35D-56 4301353040 5 S 6 VV 35 OilVVell Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 8-14D-55 4301353099 5 S 5 VV 14 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC FEE 13-36D-56 4301353114 5 S 6 VV 36 OilVVell Approved Permit
LC FEE 11-36D-56 4301353115 5 S 6 VV 36 Oil Well Approved Permit
LC Nielsen Fee 15-28D-56 4301353131 5 S 6 W 28 Oil Well Approved Permit
UTE TRIBAL 3-20D-55 4301333280 5 S 5 W 20 18424 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL4H-17-56 4301333540 5 S 6 W 17 18067 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL8-20D-55 4301333676 5 S 5 W 20 17308 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 14-14D-55 4301333699 5 S 5 VV 14 18409 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 5-29D-55 4301333740 5 S 5 W 29 17306 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL7-32D-55 4301333794 5 S 5 W 32 18359 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 12-27D-55 4301333798 5 S 5 W 27 18360 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
BERRY_TRIBAL2-23D-54 4301333805 5 S 4 W 23 18546 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 13-29D-55 4301333807 5 S 5 W 29 18378 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-55 4301333887 5 S 5 W 28 18594 _ Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
FEDERAL 10-10D-65 4301350523 6 S 5 W 10 19773 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
LCFEE8-15D-56 4301350597 5 S 6 \N 15 19347 OilVVell DrillingtDpe ations Suspended
SFW FEE 13-10D-54 4301350892 5 S 4 W 10 19186 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
SFW TRIBAL 11-10D-54 4301350893 5 S 4 W 10 19215 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 16-34D-45 4301350977 4 S 5 W 34 18658 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effective:
LC TRIBAL 5-29D-56 4301351 184 5 S W 29 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 2-33D45 430',t35',t402 4 S 5 W 33 18854 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 9-24D,45 4301351431 4 S 5 W 24

3
18861 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended

LC TRIBAL 9-3D.56 4301351514 5
5

S W 18948 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC Tribal 3-34D-56 4301352087 S W 34 19234 OilWell P!!ting9p9ra!!o_4q Susp_ 4deQ

Qttllr4g Opeq!194q Suqpgnded
Drilling Operations Suspended

LC Tribal 7-34D-56 4301352088 5 S W 34 19235 OilWell
Ute Tribal 5-9D-54 4301352463 5 S W 9 19354 OilWell
Ute Tribal 3-9D-54 4301352464 5 S W 9 19355 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL7.17D-55 352691 5 S 5 W 17 19691 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 6.17D-55 4301 352692 5 S 5 W 17 1 9708 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 3-17D-55 4301 352693 5 S 5 W 17 19709 OilWell Qf t!!t!g Opetat !9 ng.Qu sp949led

Drilling Operations SuspendedUTE TRIBAL2-17D-55 4301 352694 5 S 5 W 17 1 9692 OilWell
State Tribal 3-12D-55 4301 352697 5 S 5 W 12

12
19667 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended

State Tribal 4-12D-55 4301 352698 5 S 5 W 19668 OilWell Drillinq Operations Suspended
State Tribal 10-2D-55 4301352734 5 S 5 W 2 19710 OilWell Qt1L1g -olelat1g 4 1Q u spe ng! ed

Df illqlOpeqa'lio n s,S_qgpe 1{ed
Drilling Operations Suspended

LC TRIBAL 1-36D.56 4301353021 5 S 6 W 36 OilWell
LC TRIBAL 8.36D.56 4301353034 5 S t W 36 OilWell
LC TRIBAL 7-36D-56 4301353035 5 S 6 W 36 OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 2.36D-56 4301353037 5 S 6 W OilWell Drilling Operations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 13.17D-55 4301333550 5 S 5 W OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 11-14D-54 4301333596 5 S W 14 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 16-17D-55 4301333622 5 S 5 W 17 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 14-16D.56 4301334283 5 S W 16 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 3-23D-56 4301350624 5 S W 23 OilWell Location Abandoned
FEDERAL 2-1D-64 4301350765 6 S W 1__

1

OilWell Location Abandoned
FEDEML 7-1D-64 4!q !l0z6q

4301 350767
o S 4 W OilWell Location Abandoned

FEDERAL 9-1D-64 o S W 1
24

OilWell Location Abandoned
cc FEE 8-24-38 4301350885 3 S 8 W OilWell Location Abandoned
LC FEE 4H-12-57 43013s0952 5 S 7 W 12 OilWell Location Abandoned
cc TRTBAL 4-248 4301 350964 4 S W 2

2
OilWell Location Abandoned

LC TRIBAL 7-2D.56 4301350988 5 S W OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 1O-18D-56 4301350989 5 S W 18_

16
OilWell Location Abandoned

LC TRIBAL 3-16D-56 4301 351 032 5 S W OilWell Location Abandoned
cc FEE 6-21-38 4301 351 059 3 S W 21 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 12H-19-56 4301 351 1 93 5 S 6 W 19 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC FEE 15-11D-56 4301 351 1 97 5 S W !

11

OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 13H.10-56 4301351209 5 S 6 W OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 2-31D45 4301 351261 4 S 5 W 31 OilWell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 13H-2445 4301351273 4 s 5 W 24 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 6-21D.55 430135',t274 5 S 5 W 21 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 15.16D-55 4301351284 5 S 5 W 16 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 4H-15.55 4301351292 5 S 5 W 15 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 13H.14.54 4301351297 5 S 4 W 14 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 1-32-55 4301 351 298 5 S 5 W 32 OilWell Location Abandoned

6127t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Ëñective:May 1,2017
LC TRIBAL 5-29D-56 4301351184 5 S 6 W 29 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL2-33D-45 4301351402 4 S 5 W 33 18854 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 9-24D-45 4301351431 4 S 5 W 24 18861 Oil Well DrilligOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 9-3D-56 4301351514 5 S 6 W 3 18948 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
LC Tribal 3-34D-56 4301352087 5 S 6 W 34 19234 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
LC Tribal7-34D-56 4301352088 5 S 6 \N 34 19235 OilVVell DrillingOperationsSuspended
Ute Tribal 5-9D-54 4301352463 5 S 4 W 9 19354 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
Ute Tribal 3-9D-54 4301352464 5 S 4 W 9 19355 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 7-17D-55 4301352691 5 S 5 W 17 19691 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL6-17D-55 4301352692 5 S 5 W 17 19708 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 3-17D-55 _ 4301352693 5 S 5 W 17 19709 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL2-17D-55 4301352694 5 S 5 W 17 19692 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
State Tribal 3-12D-55 4301352697 5 S 5 W 12 19667 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
State Tribal 4-12D-55 4301352698 5 S 5 W 12 19668 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
State Tribal 10-2D-55 4301352734 5 S 5 W 2 19710 Oil Well DrillingOperatigns Suspended
LC TRIBAL 1-36D-56 4301353021 5 S 6 W 36 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 8-36D-56 4301353034 5 S 6 W 36 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL 7-36D-56 4301353035 5 S 6 W 36 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
LC TRIBAL2-36D-56 4301353037 5 S 6 W 36 Oil Well DrillingOperations Suspended
UTE TRIBAL 13-17D-55 4301333550 5 S 5 W 17 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 11-14D-54 4301333596 5 S 4 W 14 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 16-17D-55 \4301333622 5 S 5 W 17 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LCTTIIBAL14-16D-56 4301334283 5 S 6 VV 16 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 3-23D-56 4301350624 5 S 6 W 23 Oil Well Location Abandoned
FEDERAL 2-1D-64 4301350765 6 S 4 W 1 Oil Well Location Abandoned
FEDEFLAL7-1D-64 4301350766 6 S 4 VV 1 OilVVell Location Abandoned
FET)EFDAL9-1D-64 4301350767 6 S 4 VV 1 OilVVell Location Abandoned
DC FEE8-24-38 4301350885 3 S 8 VV 24 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC FEE4H-12-57 4301350952 5 S 7 VV 12 OilVVell Location Abandoned
CC TRIBAL4-2-48 4301350964 4 S 8 W 2 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 7-2D-56 4301350988 5 S 6 W 2 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LCTTRIBAL10-18D-56 4301350989 5 S 6 VV 18 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 3-16D-56 4301351032 5 S 6 VV 16 Oil Well Location Abandoned
CC FEE6-21-38 4301351059 3 S 8 VV 21 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL12H-19-56 4301351193 5 S 6 VV 19 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC:FEE 15-11D-56 4301351197 5 S 6 VV 11 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC11tlE14L 13H-10-56 4301351209 5 S 6 VV 11 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTRIBAA.2-31D-45 4301351261 4 S 5 VV 31 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC17tlELAL13H-24-45 4301351273 4 S 5 \N 24 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIELAL6-21D-55 4301351274 5 S 5 VV 21 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAA.15-16D-55 4301351284 5 S 5 VV 16 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTETRIBAL4H-15-55 4301351292 5 S 5 VV 15 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 13H-14-54 4301351297 5 S 4 W 14 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 1-32-55 4301351298 5 S 5 W 32 Oil Well Location Abandoned
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
"rom: Linn Operating, LLC
¯o: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL4-21D-55 4301351299 5 S 5 W 21 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 12-33-45 4301351301 4 S 5 W 33 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 16-15D-55 4301351302 5 S 5 W 15 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL2-24-55 4301351304 5 S 5 W 24 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 11-32D-56 4301351315 5 S 6 W 32 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 1-32D-56 4301351317 5 S 6 W 32 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 5H-32-56 4301351318 5 S 6 W 32 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 14-28-45 4301351339 4 S 5 W 28 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC ŸRÏBAL16-32D-45 4301351340 4 S 5 W 32 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 3-31-45 4301351347 4 S 5 W 31 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 1-18D-56 4301351367 5 S 6 W 18 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL9-18D-56 4301351368 5 S 6 W 18 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC FEE 9-23D-56 4301351380 5 S 6 W 23 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 1-340-45 4301351382 4 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 12-21D-56 4301351383 5 S 6 W 21 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 7-29D-56 4301351386 5 S 6 W 29 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL6-15-55 4301351399 5 S 5 W 15 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL7-21D-55 4301351403 5 S 5 W 21 Oil Well Location Abandoned
CC FEE 13-9D-37 4301351409 3 S 7 W 9 Oil Well Location Abandoned
CC FEE 16-21D-38 4301351410 3 S 8 W 21 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 5H-10-54 4301351415 5 S 4 W 10 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC FEE 14-1-56 4301351457 5 S 6 W 1 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 5-3D-56 4301351459 5 S 6 W 3 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 12H-23-56 \4301351488 5 S 6 W 23 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 12HH-31-45 4301351499 4 S 5 W 32 Oil Well Location Abandoned
CC Tribal 3-27D-38 4301351604 3 S 8 W 27 Oil Well Location Abandoned
Myrin Fee 3-16D-55 4301351633 5 S 5 W 16 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 12H-34-56 4301351634 5 S 6 W 34 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 12-16D-55 4301351635 5 S 5 W 16 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 13-11D-58 4301351708 5 S 8 W 11 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 15-11D-58 4301351709 5 S 8 W 11 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC FEE 1-11D-56 4301351712 5 S 6 W 11 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 8M-23-45 4301351722 4 S 5 W 23 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 3-14D-58 4301351726 5 S 8 W 11 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 11-11D-58 4301351729 5 S 8 W 11 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC TRIBAL8-31D-56 4301351746 5 S 6 W 31 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Fee 2-6D-57 4301351749 5 S 7 W 6 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 15-12D-58 4301351783 5 S 8 W 12 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 9-12D-58 4301351784 5 S 8 W 12 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 1-13D-58 4301351785 5 S 8 W 12 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 13-7D-57 4301351786 5 S 8 W 12 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 9-2D-58 4301351788 5 S 8 W 2 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 1-2D-58 4301351789 5 S 8 W 2 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 5-1D-58 4301351790 5 S 8 W 2 Oil Well Location Abandoned
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effective 201
LC Fee 156D-57 4301 351816 5 S 7 W 6__

31

OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Fee 7-31D45 4301 351 857 4 S 5 W OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 5-31D.45 4301351858 4 S 5 W 31 OilWell Loca!!p4lAbando1e{

Location AbandonedLC Tribal 16-31-45 4301 351 863 4 S 5 W 31 OilWell
LC FEE 4.32D45 4301 351 892 4 S 5 W 31

9_
26

OilWell Location Abandoned
CC Fee 8R-9-37 4301351937 3 S 7 W OilWell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 13-26D-56 4301352099 5 S o W OilWell Location Abandoned

Location AbandonedLC Tribal 2-27D45 4301352100 4 S 5 W 27
21
6

OilWell
LC Tribal 8-27D45 4301352101 4 S 5 W OilWell Location Abandoned

Location AbandonedAbbott Fee 1€D-54 4301352324 5 S 4 W OilWell
Abbott Fee 7-6D-54 4301352327 5 s 4__

4
W o OilWell Location Abandoned

UTE FEE 1O-9D-54 4301352475 5 S W 9 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 12.9D-54 4301352476 5 S 4

4
W I OilWell Location Abandoned

UTE FEE 16-9D-54 4301352478 5 S W o OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 11.9D-54 4301352544 5 S 4 W 9 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 6-5D-55 4301 352556 5 S 5 W 5 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 5-5D-55 4301352557 5 S 5 W 5 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 4-5D-55 4301 352558 5 S 5 W 5 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 3-5D-55 43013525_59

4301352736
5 S 5

5
5

W 5 OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 1O-3OD-55 5 S W 30

5
13
26

OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 8-5D-55 4301352773 5 S W OilWell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 1-13D.55 43013s2838 5 q

S
5
7

OilWell Location Abandoned
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26.31 4300730987 12

1?
12

E Dry Hole Plugged & Abandoned
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-43 4300730990 S 1

7
E 26 Dry Hole Plugged & Abandoned

SCOFIELD CHRISTIANSEN 8-23 4300730999 S E I Dry Hole Plugged & Abandoned
NUTTERS RIDGE FED 5.1 4301330403 6 S 4 W 5

?4
21

8231 pilWell
Dry Hole

Pluoqed & Abandoned
ANTELOPE RIDGE 24-,I 4301330426 b S 5 W Plugged & Abandoned
B C UTE TRIBAL 8-21 4301330829 5 S 4 W 8414 Water lniection Well Pluqqed & Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 16.2146 4301333575 4 S o 21 Dry Hole Plugsed & Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 8.4-56 4991

4301
339605
333802

5 S o W 4 17046 OilWell Plugged & Abandoned
FOY 9-33D-55 5 S 5 W 33 Dry Hole Plussed & Abandoned
cc FEE 7-28-38 4301350887 3 S 8 W 28 Dry Hole Plugged & Abandoned
cc FEE 8-9-37 4301350896 3 S 7 W 9 Dry Hole & Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 5HH-5-56 4301350927 5 S EI W 4 Dry Hole & Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 3-4D-56 4301 351 000 5 S o 4 Dry Hole & Abandoned
ST LOST CREEK 3244 4304930023 11 S 7

4
E 32 Dry Hole & Abandoned

BC UTE TRIBAL 4-22 4301 330755 5 S 2620 OilWell Producing
B C UTE TRIBAL 16.16 4301 330841 5 S 4 9489 OilWell Producing
B C UTE TRIBAL 14-15 4301330842 5 S 4 9440 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-32R 4301330872 5 S 4 32 1 3020 OilWell Pro{qq!ng

ProducinqUTE TRIBAL 23-3R 430'1330886 5 S
S

4 23 1 3034 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 13.3R.54 4301330924 5 4 3 9488 OilWell Producing
S COTTONWOOD RIDGE UTE TRIBAL 1-19 4301330933 5 S 4 19 9845 OilWell Producinq
TABBY CYN UTE TRIBAL 1.25 430133094s 5 S 5 25 9722 OilWell Producino

10 6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
iñective:May 1,2017
LC Fee 15-6D-57 4301351816 5 S 7 W 6 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Fee7-31D-45 4301351857 4 S 5 VV 31 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCTribal5-31D-45 4301351858 4 S 5 VV 31 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal16-31-45 4301351863 4 S 5 VV 31 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LCFEE4-32D-45 4301351892 4 S 5 VV 31 OilVVell Location Abandoned
CX3Fee8R-9-37 4301351937 3 S 7 VV 9 OilVVell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 13-26D-56 4301352099 5 S 6 VV 6 Oil VVell Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 2-27D-45 4301352100 4 S 5 W 27 Oil Well Location Abandoned
LC Tribal 8-27D-45 4301352101 4 S 5 W 27 Oil Well Location Abandoned
Abbott Fee 1-6D-54 4301352324 5 S 4 W 6 Oil Well Location Abandoned
AbboñFee7-6D-54 4301352327 5 S 4 VV 6 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 10-90-54 4301352475 5 S 4 VV 9 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 12-90-54 4301352476 5 S 4 VV 9 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 16-9D-54 4301352478 5 S 4 VV 9 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 11-9D-54 4301352544 5 S 4 VV 9 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL6-5D-55 4301352556 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 5-5D-55 4301352557 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL4-5D-55 4301352558 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 3-5D-55 4301352559 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 101-30D-55 4301352736 5 S 5 VV 30 OilVVell Location Abandoned
UTE TRIBAL 8-5D-55 4301352773 5 S 5 W 5 Oil Well Location Abandoned
UTE FEE 1-13D-55 4301352838 5 S 5 VV 13 OilVVell Location Abandoned
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-31 4300730987 12 S 7 E 26 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
SCOFIELD-THORPE 26-43 4300730990 12 S 7 E 26 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
SCOFIELD CHRISTIANSEN 8-23 4300730999 12 S 7 E 8 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
NUTTERS RIDGE FED 5-1 4301330403 6 S 4 W 5 8231 Oil Well Plugged &Abandoned
ANTELOPE RIDGE 24-1 4301330426 6 S 5 W 24 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
BC UTE TRIBAL 8-21 4301330829 5 S 4 W 21 8414 Water Injection Well Plugged &Abandoned
LC TRIBAL 16-21-46 4301333575 4 S 6 W 21 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
LC TRIBAL8-4-56 4301333605 5 S 6 W 4 17046 Oil Well Plugged &Abandoned
FOY 9-33D-55 4301333802 5 S 5 W 33 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
CC FEE 7-28-38 4301350887 3 S 8 W 28 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
CC ITE 8-9-37 4301350896 3 S 7 W 9 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
LC TRIBAL SHH-5-56 4301350927 5 S 6 W 4 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
LC TRIBAL3-4D-56 4301351000 5 S 6 W 4 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
ST LOST CREEK 32-44 4304930023 11 S 7 E 32 Dry Hole Plugged &Abandoned
BC UTE TRIBAL4-22 _ 4301330755 5 S 4 W 22 2620 Oil Well Producing
BC UTE TRIBAL 16-16 4301330841 5 S 4 W 16 9489 Oil Well Producing
BC UTE TRIBAL 14-15 4301330842 5 S 4 W 15 9440 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-32R 4301330872 5 S 4 W 32 13020 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL23-3R 4301330886 5 S 4 W 23 13034 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-3R-54 4301330924 5 S 4 W 3 9488 Oil Well Producing
S COTTONWOOD RIDGE UTE TRIBAL 1-19 4301330933 5 _ S 4 W 19 9845 Oil Well Producing
TABBY CYN UTE TRIBAL 1-25 4301330945 5 S 5 W 25 9722 Oil Well Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

Erq{qci!g

PrpQqg!!g

Brelggqg
Producing

Producing

F,lq4qqus_5Ts
5S

S 4 30 19850 OilWell
5 w zi Aoq=S OilWell

OilWell5S 24 1',t5173
S 4 W 20 19925 OilWell
S --ls W 23 i9720 OilWell

5q
q
S
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
S BRUNDAGE UTE TRIBAL 1-30 4301330948 5 S 4 W 30 9850 Oil Well Producing
SOWERS CYN UTE TRIBAL3-26 4301330955 5 S 5 W 26 10423 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-24R-55 (REENTRY) 4301330960 5 S 5 W 24 15173 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-20 4301330966 5 S 4 W 20 _ 9925 Oil Well Producing
TC UTE TRIBAL 9-23X 4301330999 5 S 5 W 23 9720 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-24R 4301331129 5 S 5 W 24 11985 Oil Well Producing
S BRUNDAGE CYN UTE TRIBAL4-27 4301331131 5 S 4 W 27 9851 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-13 4301331152 5 S 5 W 13 10421 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-20R-54 4301331281 5 S 4 W 20 14088 Oil Well Producing
Z and T UTE TRIBAL7-19 4301331282 5 S 4 W 19 11131 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-19 4301331284 5 S 4 W 19 11134 Oil Well Producing
Z and T UTE TRIBAL7-25 4301331310 5 S 5 W 25 11416 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-17 4301331546 5 S 4 W 17 11921 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-19 4301331547 5 S 4 W 19 11920 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-22 4301331548 5 S 4 W 22 11926 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-28 4301331549 5 S 4 W 28 11925 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-30 4301331550 5 S 4 W 30 11914 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-16 4301331648 5 S 4 W 16 11951 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-18 4301331650 5 S 4 W 18 11946 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-20 4301331651 5 S 4 W 20 11957 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-23 4301331671 5 S 5 W 23 11989 Oil Well Producing
TABBY CANYON 1-21 4301331699 5 S 5 W 21 12225 Oil Well Producing
TABBY CANYON 8-22 4301331700 5 S 5 W 22 12008 Oil Well Producing
SOWERS CANYON 9-27 4301331701 5 S 5 W 27 11997 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-19 4301331831 5 S 4 W 19 12175 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-19 4301331832 5 S 4 W 19 12180 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-25 4301331833 5 S 5 W 25 12153 Oil Well Produch
UTE TRIBAL 3-25 4301331834 5 S 5 W 25 12152 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-24 4301331909 5 S 5 W 24 12190 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-24 4301331910 5 S 5 W 24 12217 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-25 4301331911 5 S 5 W 25 12182 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-26 4301331912 5 S 5 W 26 12235 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-19 4301332140 5 S 4 W 19 12795 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-25H 4301332143 5 S 5 W 25 12750 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-18 4301332144 5 S 4 W 18 12746 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-17 4301332145 5 S 4 W 17 12747 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-17 4301332146 5 S 4 W 17 12745 Oil Well Producine
UTE TRIBAL 15-18 4301332148 5 S 4 W 18 12794 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-22 4301332163 5 S W 22 12974 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-21 4301332164 5 S 4 W 21 12994 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-28 4301332166 5 S 4 W 28 12995 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-20 4301332168 5 S 4 W 20 12946 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-25 4301332169 5 S 5 W 25 12857 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-27 4301332179 5 S 4 W 27 12975 Oil Well Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

20
UTE TRIBAL 1.34 4301332186 5 S 4 W 34

35
13121 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 2-35 4301332187 5 S 5 W 13021 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-36 4301 3321 88 5 S 5 W 36 1 3063 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-28 4301332189 5 S 4 W 28 1 3026 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-31 4301332190 5 S 4 W 31 1 3080 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-26 4301332't91 5 S 4 W 29_

28
29

13101 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL'11-28 4301332192 5 S 4 W 13022 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-29 4301332193 5 S I

4
W 13042 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 5-19 4301332204 5 S W 19 1 3090 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12.15 4301332205 5 S 4 W 15 13100 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13.20 4301332206 5 S 4 W 20 1 3048 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-24-55 4301332259 5 S 5 W 24 13618 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBALS-28-54 4301332261 5 S 4 W 28 13644 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-26-55 430',t332264 5 S 5 W 26 13642 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-36-55 4301332265 5 S 5 W 36 1 3600 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8.35-55 4301332267 5 S 5 W 35 13571 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-24.55 4301332268 5 S 5 W 24 1 3620 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-23-55 4301 332269 5 S 5 W 23 13572 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-25.55 4301332271 5 S 5 W 25 1 3566 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-14-55 4301332272 5 S 5 W 14 1 3567 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-27-55 4301332339 5 S 5 W 27 14020 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5.15-55 4301332344 5 S 5

5
W 15 1 3606 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBALT-20.55 4301332346 5 S W 20 1 3607 OilWell Producing
MOON TRTBAL 12-23-54 4301332347 5 S 4 W 23 14008 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-28.55 1332348 5 S 5 W 28 1 3580 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-55 4301332349 5 S 5 W 29 1 3581 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-32-55 4301 332350 5 S 5 W 1 3695 OilWell Producing
FOY TRIBAL 11-34-55 43013323s1 5 S 5 W 1 3648 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16.35.55 4301332352 5 S 5 W 35 14267 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-35-55 4301 332353 E

5
S 5 W 35 I 3645 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 12-36-55 4301332354 S 5 W 96
36

1 3643 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-36.55 43013323s5 5 S 5 W 14262 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-36.55 4301332356 5 S 5 W 36 14122 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-33-55 13323s7 5 S 5 W 33 13685 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-17-55 4301 332358 5 S 5 W 17 13698 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-14-54 1 332369 5 S 4 W 14 13647 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-20-54 4301332377 5 S 4 W 20 1395s OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-21-54 1332378 5 S 4 W 21 1 3907 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-20.54 4301332379 5 S 4

4
W 20 1 3906 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 5.30-54 1 332380 5 S W 30 1 3905 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-30.54 4301 332383 5 S 4 W 30 14050 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL12-21-54 4301332385 5 S 4 W 21 1 3928 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-20-54 4301332386 5 S 4 W 20 1391 1 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-28-54 4301332387 5 S 4 W 28 13908 OilWell Producino
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL 1-34 4301332186 5 S 4 W 34 13121 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-35 4301332187 5 S 5_ W 35 13021 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-36 4301332188 5 S 5 W 36 13063 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-28 4301332189 5 S 4 W 28 13026 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-31 4301332190 5 S 4 W 31 13080 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-26 4301332191 5 S 4 W 26 13101 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-28 4301332192 5 S 4 W 28 13022 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-29 4301332193 5 S 4 W 29 13042 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-19 4301332204 5 S 4 W 19 13090 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-15 4301332205 5 S 4 W 15 13100 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-20 4301332206 5 S 4 W 20 13048 Oil Well Producint
UTE TRIBAL 1-24-55 4301332259 5 S 5 W 24 13618 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-28-54 4301332261 5 S 4 W 28 13644 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-26-55 4301332264 5 S 5 W 26 13642 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-36-55 4301332265 5 S 5 W 36 13600 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-35-55 4301332267 5 S 5 W 35 13571 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-24-55 4301332268 5 S 5 W 24 13620 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-23-55 4301332269 5 S 5 W 23 13572 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-25-55 4301332271 5 S 5 W 25 13566 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-14-55 4301332272 5 S 5 W 14 13567 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-27-55 4301332339 5 S 5 W 27 14020 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-15-55 4301332344 5 S 5 W 15 13606 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-20-55 4301332346 5 S 5 W 20 13607 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL 12-23-54 4301332347 5 S 4 W 23 14008 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-28-55 4301332348 5 _ S 5 W 28 13580 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-55 4301332349 5 S 5 W 29 13581 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-32-55 4301332350 5 S 5 W 32 13695 Oil Well Producing
FOY TRIBAL 11-34-55 4301332351 5 S 5 W 34 13648 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-35-55 4301332352 5 S 5 W 35 14267 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-35-55 4301332353 5 S 5 W 35 13645 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-36-55 4301332354 5 S 5 W 36 13643 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-36-55 4301332355 5 S 5 W 36 14262 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-36-55 4301332356 5 S 5 W 36 14122 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-33-55 4301332357 5 S 5 W 33 13685 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-17-55 4301332358 5 S 5 W 17 13698 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-14-54 4301332369 5 S 4 W 14 13647 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-20-54 4301332377 5 S 4 W 20 13955 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-21-54 4301332378 5 S 4 W 21 13907 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-20-54 4301332379 5 S 4 W 20 13906 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-30-54 4301332380 5 S 4 W 13905 Oil Well Producin
UTE TRIBAL9-30-54 4301332383 5 S 4 W 30 14050 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-21-54 4301332385 5 S 4 W 21 13928 Oil Well Produch
UTE TRIBAL 15-20-54 4301332386 5 S 4 W 20 13911 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-28-54 4301332387 5 S 4 W 28 13908 Oil Well Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effective: Mav'l . 20'17

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL 9-28-54 4301332388 5 S 4 W 28 13910 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-28-54 4301332389 5 S 4 W 28 13909 Oil Well Producing
UÏE TRIBAL 9-25-55 4301332390 5 S 5 W 25 13715 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL6-27-54 4301332407 5 S 4 W 27 13969 Oil Well Producin 9
MOON TRIBAL 14-27-54 4301332408 5 S 4 W 27 13998 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-32-54 4301332410 5 S 4 W 32 13949 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-32-54 4301332411 5 S 4 W 32 13936 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-33-54 4301332413 5 S_ 4 W 33 13945 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-20-55 4301332415 5 S 5 W 20 14269 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-27-55 4301332416 5 S 5 W 27 13947 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-27-55 4301332417 5 S 5 W 27 14022 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-27-55 4301332418 5 S 5 W 27 13948 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-28-55 4301332419 5 S 5 W 28 14580 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-32-55 4301332420 5 S 5 W 32 14895 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-32-55 4301332421 5 S 5 W 32 14896 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-36-55 4301332422 5 S 5 W 36 13937 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-36-55 4301332423 5 S 5 W 36 14021 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-16-54 4301332511 5 S 4 W 16 13981 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-30-54 _ 4301332512 5 S 4 W 30 13982 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-23-55 4301332513 5 S 5 W 23 13975 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-23-55 4301332514 5 S 5 W 23 13976 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-33-54 4301332521 5 S 4 W 33 14060 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-33-54 4301332522 5 S 4 W 33 14061 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-32-54 4301332523 5 S 4 W 32 14062 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-23-55 4301332524 5 S 5 W 23 14044 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-29-54 4301332525 5 S 4 W 29 14045 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-31-54 4301332526 5 S 4 W 31 14116 Oil Well IWoducing
UTE TRIBAL 3-31-54 4301332527 5 S 4 W 31 14109 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-31-54 4301332528 5 S 4 W 31 14160 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-54 4301332529 5 S 4 W 31 14177 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-31-54 4301332530 5 S 4 W 31 14163 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-23-55 4301332536 5 S 5 W 23 14077 Oil Well Producini
UTE TRIBAL 5-23-55 4301332537 5 S 5 W 23 14108 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-32-54 4301332538 5 S 4 W 32 14199 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-32-54 4301332539 5 S 4 W 32 14112 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL 10-27-54 4301332540 5 S 4 W 27 14195 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL 12-27-54 4301332541 5 S 4 W 27 14161 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL8-27-54 4301332543 5 S 4 W 27 14139 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-33-54 4301332549 5 S 4 W 33 14162 Oil Well Producing
WILLIAMSONTRIBAL 3-34-54 4301332550 5 S 4 W M 14222 Oil Well Producing
WILLIAMSONTRIBAL5-34-54 4301332551 5 S 4 W 34 14235 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 6-2-65 4301332557 6 S 5 W 2 14655 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-29-54 4301332561 5 S 4 W 29 14316 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-29-54 4301332562 5 S 4 W 29 14354 Oil Well Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effective:Mav 1.2017
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Iffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL 11-29-54 4301332563 5 S 4 W 29 14337 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-29-54 4301332564 5 S 4 W 29 14315 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-29-54 4301332565 5 S 4 W _ 29 14367 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-35-54 4301332567 5 S 4 W 35 14266 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-13-54 4301332568 5 S 4 W _ 13 14281 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-24-54 4301332569 5 S 4 W 24 14314 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-18-54 4301332571 5 S 4 W 18 14388 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-29-54 4301332572 5 S 4 W 29 14336 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-24-54 4301332573 5 S 4 W 24 14247 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-14-54 4301332586 5 S 4 W 14 15270 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-15-54 4301332587 5 S 4 W 15 14194 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-15-54 4301332588 5 S 4 W 15 14311 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-16-54 4301332589 5 S 4 W 16 14178 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-22-54 4301332590 5 S 4 W 22 14219 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-22-54 4301332591 5 S 4 W 22 14328 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-22-54 4301332592 5 S 4 W 22 14218 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-22-54 4301332593 5 S 4 W 22 14220 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-13-55 4301332599 5 S 5 W 13 15134 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-55 4301332600 5 S 5 W 14 14236 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-15-55 4301332602 5 S 5 W 15 14263 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-21-55 4301332603 5 S 5 W 21 14385 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-22-55 4301332604 5 S 5 W 22 14268 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-22-55 4301332605 5 S 5 W 22 14298 O Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-55 4301332606 5 S 5 W 22 14330 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-55 4301332607 5 S 5 W 22 14329 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL3-27-54 4301332613 5 S 4 W 27 14416 Oil Well Producing
Ul E ÏRIBAL 5-27-55 4301332614 5 S 5 W 27 14881 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-27-55 4301332615 5 S 5 W 27 14882 OiÏWeÏI Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-22-55 4301332616 5 S 5 W 22 14370 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-22-55 4301332617 5 S 5 W 22 14921 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-55 4301332620 5 S 5 W 25 14365 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-20-54 4301332621 5 S 4 W 20 14518 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-20-54 4301332622 5 S 4 W 20 14382 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-22-54 4301332624 5 S 4 W _ 22 14547 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-30-54 4301332625 5 S 4 W 30 14364 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-10-54 4301332663 5 S 4 W 10 14414 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-32-54 4301332666 5 S 4 W 32 14460 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-31-55 4301332673 5 _ S 5 W 31 14407 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-35-54 4301332675 5 S 4 W 35 14656 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-30-55 4301332680 5 S 5 W 30 14427 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-17-54 4301332687 5 S 4 W 17 15309 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-31-54 4301332688 5 S 4 W 31 14517 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-19-54 4301332690 5 S 4 W 19 14546 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL16-19-54 4301332691 5 S 4 W 19 14491 Oil Well Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effective 201
UTE TRIBAL 13-32-54 4301 332692 5 S 4 W 32 14490 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-14-55 4301 332693 5 S 5 W 14 15136 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 4301 332694 5 S 5 W 28 14574 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6-1.65 4301 332699 o S 5 W 1 15776 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-15.55 4301332701, 5 S 5 W 15 14573 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-20-54 4301332702 5 S 4 W 20 14459 OilWell Producing
#1 DLB 12-15-56 4301332710 5 S 6 W 15 14943 Gas Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12.19-54 4301332716 5 S W 19

19
14627 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 1O-19-54 4301332717 5 S 4 W 14628 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-30-54 4301332718 5 S W 30 14604 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-12-55 4301332721 5 S 5 W 12 14605 OilWell Producing
NIELSEN MARSING 1 3-14-56 4301332737 5 S W 14 15060 OilWell Producing
TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 4301 332738 5 S W 22 15058 OilWell Producing
UTE TRlBAL 16-20-54 4301 332739 5 S W 20 14671 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-20.54 4301332740 5 S 4 W 20 14691 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL4.28-54 4301332741 5 S W 28 14672 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-33-54 4301332742 5 S 4 W 33 14736 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-31-54 4301332743 5 S 4 W 31 14690 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8.30-5.4 4301332746 5 S 4 W 30 't5583 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-25-55 4301332749 5 S 5 W 25 14758 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-55 4301332750 5 S 5 W 25 14798 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-36-55 4301332751 5 S 5 W 36 11842

14865
OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 16.16.55 4301332757 5 S 5 W 16 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3.21-55 4301332758 5 S 5 W 2'.1 15112 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16.25-55 4301332759 5 S 5 W 25

36
14821 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 1-36-55 4301 332760 5 S 5 W 14822 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL7.22.54 4301332761 5 S 4 W 22 1 5661 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-31.54 4301332762 5 S 4 W 31 14845 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-28-54 4301332763 5 S 4 W 28 14723 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL ,I0-28-54 4301332764 5 S 4 W 28 14722 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 12-28-54 4301332765 5 S 4 W 28 14701 OilWell Producing
UTE TR]BALS-28-54 4301 332766 5 s 4 W 28 14777 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL4.31-54 4301332767 5 S 4 W 31 14494 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15.33-54 4301332768 5 S 4 W 33 '15210 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 12.25-55 4301332769 5 S 5 W 25 14799 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-54 4301332774 5 S 4 W 35 1s01e

14762
OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 16.24-54 4301332775 5 S 4 W 24 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL'14-25-54 4301332776 5 S 4 W 25 14753 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-54 4301332779 5 S 4 25 1 5078 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-54 4301 332780 5 S 4 W 25 1 5280 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-54 4301332781 5 S 4 W 35 15535 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 6-30-55 4301332783 5 S 5 W 30 15163 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 4.23.54 4301332800 5 S 4 W 23 14985 OilWell Producinq
MOON TRIBAL 5-27.54 4301332802 5 S 4 W 27 14984 OilWell Producinq

15 6127t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Iffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL 13-32-54 4301332692 5 S 4 W 32 14490__ Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-14-55 4301332693 5 S 5 W 14 15136 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-55 4301332694 5 S 5 W 28 14574 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 6-1-65 4301332699 6 S 5 W 1 15776 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-15-55 4301332701 5 S 5 W 15 14573 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-20-54 4301332702 5 S 4 W 20 14459 Oil Well Producing
#1 DLB 12-15-56 4301332710 5 S 6 W 15 14943 Gas Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-19-54 4301332716 5 S 4 W 19 14627 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-19-54 4301332717 5 S 4 W 19 14628 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-30-54 4301332718 5 S 4 W 30 14604 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-12-55 4301332721 5 S 5 W 12 14605 Oil Well Producing
NIELSEN MARSING 13-14-56 4301332737 5 S 6 W 14 15060 Oil Well Producing
TAYLOR HERRICK 10-22-56 4301332738 5 S 6 W 22 15058 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-20-54 4301332739 5 S 4 W 20 14671 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-20-54 4301332740 5 S 4 W 20 14691 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-28-54 4301332741 5 S 4 W 28 14672 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-33-54 4301332742 5 S 4 W 33 14736 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-31-54 4301332743 5 S _ 4 W 31 14690 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-30-54 4301332746 5 S 4 W 30 15583 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-25-55 4301332749 5 S 5 W 25 14758 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-55 4301332750 5 S 5 W 25 14798 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-36-55 4301332751 5 S 5 W 36 14842 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-16-55 _ 4301332757 5 S 5 W 16 14865 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-55 4301332758 5 S 5 W 21 15112 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-55 4301332759 5 S 5 W 25 14821 Oil Well Producin
UTE TRIBAL 1-36-55 4301332760 5 S 5 W 36 14822 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-22-54 4301332761 5 S 4 W 22 15661 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-31-54 4301332762 5 S 4 W 31 14845 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-28-54 4301332763 5 S 4 W 28 14723 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-28-54 4301332764 5 S 4 W 28 14722 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-28-54 4301332765 5 S 4 W 28 14701 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-28-54 4301332766 5 S 4 W 28 14777 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-31-54 4301332767 5 S 4 W 31 14494 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-33-54 4301332768 5 S 4 W 33 15210 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-25-55 4301332769 5 S 5 W 25 14799 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-54 4301332774 5 S 4 W 35 15019 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-54 4301332775 5 S 4 W 24 14762 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-25-54 4301332776 5 S 4 W 25 14753 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-25-54 4301332779 5 S 4 W 25 15078 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-25-54 4301332780 5 S 4 W 25 15280 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-54 4301332781 5 S 4 W 35 15535 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-30-55 4301332783 5 S 5 W 30 15163 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL4-23-54 4301332800 5 S 4 W 23 14985 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL5-27-54 4301332802 5 S 4 W 27 14984 Oil Well Producing

15 6/27/201



From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

7
UTE TRIBAL2-32-54 4301332803 5 S 4 W 32 15151 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15.35-54 4301!9?9q1

4301332805
5 S 4 W 35

35
15185 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 5-35-54 5 S 4 W 15485 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-35-54 4301332806 5 S 4 W 35 15292 OilWell Prgduq!!g

ProducingUTE TRIBAL 11.35-54 4301332807 5 S 4 W 35 15317 OilWell
UTE TRIBAL 8-19-54 4301332840 5 S 4 W 19 14946 OilWell Producing
UTE TR]BAL 13-20-55 430',t332841 5 S 5 W 20 15097 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL16-22-54 4301332842 5 S I

4
W 22_

23
1s015 OilWell Producing

MOON TRIBAL 6-23-54 4301332843 5 S W 151 13 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBALll-26-54 4301332844 5 S 4 W 26 15233 OilWell Producing
MOON TRTBAL 15-27-54 4301332846 5 S 4 W 27 151 15 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1O-31.54 4301332847 5 S 4 W 31 14956 Well Producing
ST TRIBAL 6-15.54 4301332848 5 S 4 W 15 16656 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 2.15-54 4301 332849 5 S 4 W 15 16959 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 4-15-54 4301 3328s0 5 S 4 W 15 17478 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 8-15-54 43013328s1 5 S 4 W 15 16279 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 4301 332856 5 S 4 W 25 15430 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-30-55 4301 332862 5 S 5

5
W 30 15340 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 7-19-55 4301 332863 5 S W 19 15279 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-19-55 4301 332864 5 S 5 W 19 15241 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6.19.54 4301332865 5 S 4 W 19 14947 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL12.20.54 49.013Q?8iq

4301 332867
5 S 4 W 20

21

14924 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3.2'I-54 q

5
S 4 W 15554 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL2-26.54 4301332868 S 4 W 26 15231 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 4301332869 5 S 4 W 31 14970 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-32-54 4301332870 5 S 4 W 32 15152 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4.33-54 4301332871 5 S 4 W 33 15040 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6.33-54 4301332872 5 S 4 W 33 1 5059 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL9.22-54 4301332889 5 S 4 W 22 1 5607 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5.26-54 4301 332890 5 S 4 W 26 1 5268 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-26-54 4301 332891 5 S 4 W 26 15287 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-28D.54 4301332892 5 S 4 W 28 15232 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-3OD-54 4301332894 5 S 4 W 30 1 5298 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-32-54 4301 332896 5 S 4 W 32 1 5555 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-32D-54 4301 332897 5 S 4 W 32 15312 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2-33D-54 4301332898 5 S 4 W 33

32
1527',L OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 12-32-54 4301332925 5 S 4 W 1 5503 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16.32D.54 4301 332926 5 S 4 W 32 16971 OilWell Producing
MOON TRTBAL ',t6-23-54 4301332927 5 S

S
4 W 23 15219 Well Producing

UTE TRIBAL4-25-55 4901!l?e2q
4301 332929

5 5 W 25 1542',1 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-36-55 5 S 5 W 36 15341 Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-36-55 4301 332930 5 S 5 W 36 1 5301 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 4301332931 5 S 4 W 2 15429 Well Producing
MYRIN TRIBAL 16-19-55 4301332934 5 S 5 W 19 15339 Well Producino

16 6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Iffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL2-32-54 4301332803 5 S 4 W 32 15151 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-35-54 4301332804 5 S 4 W 35 15185 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-35-54 4301332805 5 S 4 W 35 15485 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-35-54 4301332806 5 S 4 W 35 15292 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-54 4301332807 5 S 4 W 35 15317 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-19-54 4301332840 5 S 4 W 19 14946 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-20-55 4301332841 5 S 5 W 20 15097 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-22-54 4301332842 5 S 4 W 22 15015 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL6-23-54 4301332843 5 S 4 W 23 15113 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-26-54 4301332844 5 S 4 W 26 15233 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL 15-27-54 4301332846 5 S 4 W 27 15115 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-31-54 4301332847 5 S 4 W 31 14956 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL6-15-54 4301332848 5 S 4 W 15 16656 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL2-15-54 4301332849 5 S 4 W 15 16959 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL4-15-54 4301332850 5 S 4 W 15 17478 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL8-15-54 4301332851 5 S 4 W 15 16279 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-54 4301332856 5 S 4 W 25 15430 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-30-55 4301332862 5 S 5 W 30 15340 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-19-55 4301332863 5 S 5 W 19 15279 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-19-55 4301332864 5 S 5 W 19 15241 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-19-54 4301332865 5 S 4 W 19 14947 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-54 4301332866 5 S 4 W 20 14924 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-21-54 4301332867 5 S 4 W 21 15554 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-26-54 4301332868 5 S 4 W 26 15231 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-31-54 4301332869 5 S 4 W 31 14970 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-32-54 4301332870 5 S 4 W 32 15152 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-33-54 4301332871 5 S 4 W 33 15040 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-33-54 4301332872 5 S 4 W 33 15059 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-22-54 4301332889 5 S 4 W 22 15607 Oil Well Producini
UTE TRIBAL5-26-54 4301332890 5 S 4 W 26 15268 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-26-54 4301332891 5 S 4 W 26 15287 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-28D-54 4301332892 5 S 4 W 28 15232 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-30D-54 4301332894 5 S 4 W 30 15298 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-32-54 4301332896 5 S 4 W 32 15555 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-32D-54 4301332897 5 S 4 W 32 15312 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-33D-54 4301332898 5 S 4 W 33 15271 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-32-54 4301332925 5 S 4 W 32 15503 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-32D-54 4301332926 5 S 4 W 32 16971 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL 16-23-54 4301332927 5 S 4 W 23 15219 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-25-55 4301332928 5 S 5 W 25 15421 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-36-55 4301332929 5 S 5 W 36 15341 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-36-55 4301332930 5 S 5 W 36 15301 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL 10-2-54 4301332931 5 S 4 W 2 15429 Oil Well Producing
MYRINTRIBAL 16-19-55 4301332934 5 S 5 W 19 15339 Oil Well Producing

16 6/27/201



From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL2-31-55 4301332935 5 S 5 W 31 15428 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-31 55 4301332936 5 S 5 W 31 15354 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL 1-27-54 4301332937 5 S 4 W 27 15308 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL 5-23-54 4301332938 5 S 4 W 23 15584 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL 7-18-54 4301332952 5 S 4 W 18 15724 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL 5-18-54 4301332953 5 S 4 W 18 15781 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-15-54 4301332971 5 S 4 W 15 15310 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-19-54 4301332972 5 S 4 W 19 15382 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-20-54 4301332973 5 S 4 W 20 15245 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-20-54 4301332974 5 S 4 W 20 15269 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-15-55 4301332976 5 S 5 W 15 15311 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-15-55 4301332977 5 S 5 W 15 15380 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-15-55 4301332978 5 S 5 W 15 15299 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-15-55 4301332979 5 S 5 W 15 15369 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-55 4301332980 5 S 5 W 15 15342 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-18-55 4301332984 5 S 5 W 18 15671 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-24-56 4301332988 5 S 6 W 24 15740 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-24-56 4301332989 5 S 6 W 24 15782 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-25-56 4301332990 5 S 6 W 25 15627 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL7-25-56 4301332991 5 S 6 W 25 15617 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL5-25-56 4301332992 5 S 6 W 25 15648 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-25-56 4301332993 5 S 6 W 25 15561 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-15D-54 4301333039 5 S 4 W 15 15368 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-28D-54 4301333041 5 S 4 W 28 15377 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-31D-54 4301333042 5 S 4 W 31 15419 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-22-55 4301333044 5 S 5 W 22 15381 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-23-55 4301333046 5 S 5 W 23 15211 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-35-55 4301333047 5 S 5 W 35 15378 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-35-55 4301333048 5 S 5 W 35 15367 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-36-55 _ 4301333049 5 S 5 W 6 15379 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-12-55 4301333055 5 S 5 W 12 15618 Oil Well Producin
UTE TRIBAL 5-13-54 4301333075 5 S 4 W 13 15873 Oil Well Producin
UTE TRIBAL 16-29-54 4301333076 5 S 4 W 29 17074 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-18-54 4301333077 5 S 4 W 18 15575 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-33-54 4301333089 5 S 4 W 33 15398 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-33-54 4301333090 5 S 4 W 33 15417 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-33-54 4301333091 5 S 4 W 33 15397 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-33-54 4301333092 5 S 4 W 33 15418 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-33-54 4301333093 5 S 4 W 33 15399 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-14-54 4301333111 5 S 4 W 14 16832 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-14-54 4301333112 5 S 4 W 14 15440 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-21-54 4301333113 5 S 4 W 21 15471 Oil Well Producil
UTE TRIBAL 11-21-54 4301333115 5 S 4 W 21 15470 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-22-54 4301333116 5 S 4 W 22 15662 Oil Well Producing

17 6/27/201



From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

1

UTE TRIBAL2-21-55 4301 3331 1 7 5 S 5 21 15582 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-28-55 4301 3331 1 8 5 S 5 W 28 15506 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-29-55 4301 3331 1 9 5 S 5 29 15507 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-29-55 4301 333120 5 S 5 W 29 15504 OilWell Producing
TAYLOR FEE 13-22-56 4301 333121 5 S 6 22 15525 OilWell Producing
wrlcox ELTASoN 7-15-56 4301333122 5 S 6 15 15526 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-16-54 4301 333123 5 S 4 16 15639 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-16-54 4301333128 q

5
S 4 l6

16
15420 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 1O-16-54 4301 333129 S 4 15454 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-16-54 4301333130 5

5
S 4 16 15455 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 4301333131 S 4 W 16

11
17

154s6 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-17-54 4301333132 5 S 4 15524 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10.17.54 4301 3331 33 5 S 4 1558'l OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-24D-55 4301 3331 34 5 S 5 24 15567 OilWell Producing
wrLcox FEE 1-20-56 4301 3331 50 5 S 6 20 15745 OilWell Producing
NIELSEN FEE 13-11.56 4301 3331 52 5 S 6 11 1s600 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL2.29-54 4301 3331 53 5 S 4 29 15919 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14.29-54 4301 3331 54 5 S 4 29 15831 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-29-54 4301333155 5 S 4 29 't5847 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1O-24D-55 4301 3331 56 5 S 5 24 15556 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1O-29D-55 4301 3331 57 5 S 5 29 15505 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6.29-54 4301333172 5 S 4 29

25

't5846 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 120-25-55 4301333't84 q

5
S 5 15744 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 3G-31.54 4301 3331 85 S 4 31

36
15746 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 1I-36-55 4301 3331 86 E
5

S 5 15865 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-23D-55 4301 3331 87 S 5 23 15996 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBALS-14-54 4301 333204 5 S 4 14 15656 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-14-54 4301 333205 5 S 4 14 15680 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11.15-54 4301 333206 5 S 4 ll

16
15643 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 9-16-54 4301 333207 5 S 4 W 15660 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL3-22-54 4301 333208 5 S 4 22

13
15640 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 15.13D-55 4301333212 5 S 5 15642 OilWell Ploducinl
ProducingUTE TRIBAL 6-22D-55 4301 33321 3 5 S 5 22 16831 OilWell

UTE TRIBAL 11-36D-55 4301333214 5 S 5 36 15702 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL'I-22D-54 4301 33321 5 5 S 4 22 15641 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 1-23-54 4301333216 5 S 4 23 15931 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 15-23-54 4301333217 5 S 4 W 23 1s932 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-36D-55 4301 333239 5 I

S
5 36 15933 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 9S.25.55 430',|333245 5 5 25 15962 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12.32-55 4301333266 5 S 5 W

W
32 15681 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 16.22D-55 4301333267 5 S 5 22 15703 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-14D-54 4301333270 5 S 4 W 14 15679 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 95-19-54 4301 333276 5 S W 19

28
16153 OilWell Producinq

UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 4301333277 5 S 4 W 15818 OilWell Producino

18 6127t2017

¯rom: Linn Operating, LLC
fo: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL2-21-55 4301333117 5 S 5 W 21 15582 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-28-55 4301333118 5 S 5 W 28 15506 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-29-55 4301333119 5 S 5 W 29 15507 Oil Well oducing
UTE TRIBAL6-29-55 4301333120 5 S 5 W 29 15504 Oil Well Producing
TAYLOR l¯EE n-22-56 4301333121 5 S 6 W 22 15525 Oil Well Producing
WILCOX ELIASON 7-15-56 4301333122 5 S 6 W 15 15526 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-16-54 4301333123 5 S 4 W 16 15639 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-16-54 4301333128 5 S 4 W 16 15420 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-16-54 4301333129 5 S 4 W 16 15454 Oil Well Producit
UTE TRIBAL7-16-54 4301333130 5 S 4 W 16 15455 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-16-54 4301333131 5 S 4 W 16 15456 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-17-54 4301333132 5 S 4 W 17 15524 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-17-54 4301333133 5 S 4 W 17 15581 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-24D-55 4301333134 5 S 5 W 24 15567 Oil Well Producing
WILCOX FEE 1-20-56 4301333150 5 S 6 W 20 15745 Oil Well Producing
NIELSEN FEE 13-11-56 4301333152 5 S 6 W 11 15600 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-29-54 4301333153 5 S 4 W 29 15919 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-29-54 4301333154 5 S 4 W 29 15831 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-29-54 4301333155 5 S 4 W 29 15847 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-24D-55 4301333156 5 S 5 W 24 15556 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL10-29D-55 4301333157 5 S 5 W 29 15505 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-29-54 4301333172 5 S 4 W 29 15846 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12Q-25-55 4301333184 5 S 5 W 25 15744 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3G-31-54 4301333185 5 S 4 W 31 15746 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-36-55 4301333186 5 S 5 W 36 15865 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-23D-55 4301333187 5 S 5 W 23 15996 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-14-54 4301333204 5 S 4 W 14 15656 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-14-54 4301333205 5 S 4 W 14 15680 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-15-54 4301333206 5 S 4 W 15 15643 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-16-54 4301333207 5 S 4 W 16 15660 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-22-54 4301333208 5 S 4 W 22 15640 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-13D-55 4301333212 5 S 5 W 13 15642 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-22D-55 4301333213 5 S 5 W 22 16831 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-36D-55 4301333214 5 S 5 W 36 15702 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-54 4301333215 5 S 4 W 22 15641 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 1-23-54 4301333216 5 S 4 W 23 15931 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 15-23-54 4301333217 5 S 4 W 23 15932 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-36D-55 4301333239 5 S 5 W 36 15933 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL98-25-55 4301333245 5 S 5 W 25 15962 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-32-55 4301333266 5 S 5 W 32 15681 _ Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-22D-55 4301333267 5 S 5 W 22 15703 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-14D-54 4301333270 5 S 4 W 14 15679 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL98-19-54 4301333276 5 S 4 W 19 16153 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-28-54 4301333277 5 S 4 W 28 15818 Oil Well Producing

18 6/27/201



From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effective:Mav 1.2017

6t2712017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Iffective:MaY1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL 14-28D-54 4301333278 5 S 4 W 28 5817 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-55 4301333279 5 S 5 W 14 118408 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-18-54 4301333300 5 S 4 W 18 15747 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-21-54 4301333324 5 S 4 W 21 15748 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-31D-54 4301333325 5 S 4 W 31 16185 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-31D-54 4301333326 5 S 4 W 31 15800 Oil Well Producin
UTE TRIBAL 16-13D-55 4301333327 5 S 5 W 13 15891 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-13D-55 4301333328 5 S 5 W 13 15892 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-21-55 4301333357 5 S 5 W 21 15791 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-23D-55 4301333358 5 S 5 W 23 15799 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-26D-55 4301333359 5 S 5 W 26 15853 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-55 4301333360 5 S 5 W 26 15852 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-55 4301333361 5 S 5 W 26 15938 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15 26D-55 4301333362 5 S 5 W 26 15869 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-32D-55 4301333363 5 S 5 W 32 15936 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-14-54 4301333364 5 S 4 W 14 15790 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL 7-27D-54 4301333365 5 S 4 W 27 15935 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-32-55 4301333379 5 S 5 W 32 15819 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13H-16-55 4301333380 5 S 5 W 16 18357 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 7-23-54 4301333381 5 S 4 W 23 15934 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 9-34-54 4301333382 5 S 4 W 34 16024 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 7-34-54 4301333383 5 S 4 W 34 16102 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL4-34-54 4301333384 5 S 4 W 34 16588 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 2-2-65 4301333385 6 S 5 W 2 16150 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 5-4-65 4301333387 6 S 5 W 4 17599 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1A-29-54 4301333393 5 S 4 W 29 17075 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 15-34-54 4301333411 5 S 4 W 34 16037 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL8-23D-54 4301333417 5 S 4 W 23 16101 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-29D-55 4301333418 5 S 5 W 29 17307 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-24-55 4301333420 5 S 5 W 24 15997 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-25D-55 4301333421 5 S 5 W 25 16589 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 10-34D-54 4301333422 5 S 4 W 34 16038 Oil Well Producing
1-15-56 DLB 4301333447 5 S 6 W 15 15854 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 5-3-64 4301333448 6 S 4 W 3 16098 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 8-1-64 4301333449 6 S 4 W 1 16152 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 5-4-64 4301333450 6 S 4 W 4 17851 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 11-10-65 4301333451 6 S 5 W 10 16281 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 943-54 4301333465 5 S 4 W 23 16590 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-26D-55 4301333476 5 S 5 W 26 16657 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-55 4301333477 5 S 5 W 26 16658 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-26D-55 4301333478 5 S 5 W 26 16659 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14Q-30-54 4301333479 5 S 4 W 30 16151 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 5-6-65 4301333489 6 S 5 W 6 17852 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 16-5-65 4301333490 6 S 5 W 5 16833 Oil Well Producing

19 6/27/201



From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effectlve: 201
FEDERAL 6-11-65 4301333491 6 S 5 W 11 16335 OilWell
LC TRIBAL 14-2-56 4301333492 p

5
5

S 6 W 2

91
3l
34

18358 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-31-55 4301333s01 S 5 W 17104 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-55 4301333508 S 5 W 17103 OilWell Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 11-UD-54 4301333529 5 S 4 W 16099 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 2.16D-56 4301333s38 5 S 6 W 16 1 7305 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 4-16-56 4301 333539 5

5
S 6 W 16

17
16272 OilWell Producing

LC TRIBAL 3-17-56 4301 333541 S 6 W 16459 OilWell
OilWell

Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-2OD-55 4301 333549 5 S 5 W 20 18075 Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-23D-55 4301 333552 5 S 5 W 23 16662 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 8-28-46 4301 333576 4 S W 161 55 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 7-3-56 4301 333577 5 S W 3 16379 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 3-5-56 4301 333580 5 S W 5 17082 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 8-2D-64 4301333581 6 S W 2 16't00 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 13H.3-56 4301333591 5 S W 3 't8129 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 6-12-57 4301333593 5 S 7 W 12 17083 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-26D-54 4301333595 5 S 4 W 26 16591 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 12H6-56 4301 333606 5 S W 6 18037 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 7-7D-56 4lQ l3_96q2

4301333608
5 S W 7 18038 OilWell Producing

LC TRIBAL 1-9-56 5 S W I
14
26

4
36
26
22

16380 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBALs-14-54 4301333619 5 S 4 W 16945 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1O-26D-54 4301333620 5 S W 16663 qI We!

OilWell
Producing
ProducingUTE TRIBAL7.26D-54 4301333621 5 S 4

5
W 16664

UTE TRIBAL 13.36D-55 4301333624 5 S W 17744 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6.26D-54 4301333625 5 S W 16619 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-55 4301333626 5 S 5 W 16777 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 4-23D-55 4301 333627 5 S g

5
W 23 16818 OilWell Producins

UTE TRIBAL2-27D-55 4301333628 5 S W 27 16746 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-28D.55 4301333645 9_

5
S 5 W 28 17999 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 13-28D.55 4301 333646 S 5 W 28 18000 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14.260-54 4301 333673 5 S W 26 16299 OilWell Producing
UTE FEE 7.13D-55 4301 333674 5 S 5 W 13 18089 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9.20D-55 4301 333675 5 S 5 W 20 1 7309 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-17-56 4301 333677 5 S W 17 1 7600 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 4301 333680 5 S W 26 16638 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-26D-54 4301 333681 5 S

s
W 26 16665 OilWel ProQycfng

ProducingUTE TRIBAL 8-26D-54 4301 333682 5 W 26 17031 OilWel
UTE TRIBAL 1O-27D-55 4301 333683 5 S 5 W 27 16666 OilWel Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-27D-55 4301 333684 5 S 5 W 27 16667 OilWel Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-21D-55 4301333694 5 S 5 W 2_1

21

16296 OilWel Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-21D.55 4301333706 5 S 5 W 16298 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 2.29D.55 430',t333714 5 S 5 W z9

29
't68s4 OilWell Producing

UTE TR]BAL 7-29D.55 4301333715 5 S 5 W 16853 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13.220-55 4301 333716 5 S 5 W 22 16668 OilWell

20 6t27t20'.t7

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
FEDERAL 6-11-65 4301333491 6 S 5 W 11 16335 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 14-2-56 4301333492 5 S 6 W 2 18358 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-31-55 4301333501 5 S 5 W 31 17104 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-31-55 4301333508 5 S 5 W 31 17103 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 11-34D-54 4301333529 5 S 4 W 34 16099 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL2-16D-56 4301333538 5 S 6 W 16 17305 Oil Well IWoducing
LC TRIBAL4-16-56 4301333539 5 S 6 W 16 16272 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 3-17-56 4301333541 5 S 6 W 17 16459 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-20D-55 4301333549 5 S 5 W 20 18075 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-23D-55 4301333552 5 S 5 W 23 16662 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL8-28-46 4301333576 4 S 6 W 28 16155 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 7-3-56 4301333577 5 S 6 W 3 16379 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 3-5-56 4301333580 5 S 6 W 5 17082 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 8-2D-64 4301333581 6 S 4 W 2 16100 Oil Well Producin
LC TRIBAL 13H-3- 4301333591 5 S 6 W 3 18129 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 6-12-57 4301333593 5 S 7 W 12 17083 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-26D-54 4301333595 5 S 4 W 26 16591 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 12H-6-56 4301333606 5 S 6 W 6 18037 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL7-7D-56 4301333607 5 S 6 W 7 18038 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 1-9-56 4301333608 5 S 6 W 9 16380 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-14-54 4301333619 5 S 4 W 14 16945 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-26D-54 4301333620 5 S 4 W 26 16663 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-26D-54 4301333621 5 S 4 W 26 16664 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-36D-55 4301333624 5 S 5 W 36 17744 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-26D-54 4301333625 5 S 4 W 26 16619 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-22D-55 4301333626 5 S 5 W 22 16777 Oil Well Producia
UTE TRIBAL4-23D-55 4301333627 5 S 5 W 23 16818 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-27D-55 4301333628 5 S 5 W 27 16746 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-28D-55 4301333645 5 S 5 W 28 17999 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-28D-55 4301333646 5 S 5 W 28 18000 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-26D-54 4301333673 5 S 4 W 26 16299 Oil Well Producing
UTE FEE 7-13D-55 4301333674 5 S 5 W 13 18089 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-20D-55 4301333675 5 S 5 W 20 17309 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-17-56 4301333677 5 S 6 W 17 17600 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-26D-54 4301333680 5 S 4 W 26 16638 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-26D-54 4301333681 5 S 4 W 26 16665 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-54 4301333682 5 S 4 W 26 17031 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-27D-55 4301333683 5 S 5 W 27 16666 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-27D-55 4301333684 5 S 5 W 27 16667 Oil We11 Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-21D-55 4301333694 5 S 5 W 21 16296 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-21D-55 4301333706 5 S 5 W 21 16298 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-29D-55 4301333714 5 S 5 W 29 16854 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-29D-55 4301333715 5 S 5 W 29 16853 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-22D-55 4301333716 5 S 5 W 22 16668 Oil Well iProducing

20 6/27/201



From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effective:Mav 1.20'l
UTE TR]BAL 14-22D-55
UTE TRIBAL7.22D-55
UTE TRIBAL 1O-22D-55

BERRY TRIBAL 1O-23D-54
BERRY TRIBAL 11.23D-54

UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-54
UTE TR]BAL 1-14D.54
UTE TR]BAL 12-35D.55
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55

UTE TRIBAL 9-14D-54

FOY TRIBAL 12H.33-55

UTE T_RIBAL 8-26D-55
BERRY TRIBAL 2-34D.54

UTE TRIBAL 10-32-54
UTE TRIBAL 12.31D-54
UTE TRIBAL 12-2gD-55
UTE TRIBAL 14.20D-55

UTE TRIBAL 12-20.55
UTE TRIBAL 14.24D-55
UTE TRIBAL 14-23D.55
ST TRIBAL 1-15D-54

TRIBAL 7-15D-54
TRIBAL 9.15D.54

UTE TRIBAL 15-35D.55
UTE TRIBAL 14-35D-55
UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55

UTE TRIBAL 1-35D.55

4301333717
1333721

4301333722
1333723

430',t333724
430',t333725

333726
4301333745
4301333768
4301333769

333782
4301333783

113!!Zq4
4301333786

333787
4301333788

333793
4301333796

1333797
4301333799

1333800
4301333801

rs5gssg
_4!_q13!qqqz
4301333888
4301333902
4301333907
4301 333908

1 333951
4301 333954

1ffi055
4301 333965

diie66
4301333967

r$ge6b
4301333978

S
S
S
S
S_
S
q

I
S
S
S
S
S
S-
9_
S
S-
S

?2
2?
2?,
29_
?1
23
24

16W2
16973
17417
17416
17418
16888
17420
't7743
17455

Producina
PIqqleus
Producing
P_roducing

ftoducing
ftqducinA
PJgdu_ctlg

Producing

Prqdlells -
ProQgqr4g

lroducing -
Producing
P1glucina _
Producing

froducing

W
W
W-
w__
W
W
w__
ry
W
W
W
W
w_-
W

_S

S
S
S

9_I
S
s,_
S

w i20
--w 124

w-_
W

L,
W

35-
26
2
39
36__

?6
26

W

4301333979

6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL 14-22D-55 4301333717 5 S 5 W 22 16669 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-22D-55 4301333721 5 S 5 W 22 16670 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-22D-55 4301333722 5 S 5 W 22 16671 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-29-55 4301333723 5 S 5 W 29 16857 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 10-23D-54 4301333724 5 S 4 W 23 16592 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 11-23D-54 4301333725 5 S 4 W 23 16672 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-24D-55 4301333726 5 S 5 W 24 16673 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 6-6D-64 4301333745 6 S 4 W 6 17084 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-26D-54 4301333768 5 S 4 W 26 17450 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-14D-54 4301333769 5 S 4 W 14 17483 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-35D-55 4301333782 5 S 5 W 35 16856 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-35-55 4301333783 5 S 5 W 35 16855 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-28D-55 4301333784 5 S 5 W 28 16852 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-27D-55 4301333786 5 _ S 5 W 27 17800 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-28D-55 4301333787 5 S 5 W 28 16887 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-28D-55 4301333788 5 S 5 W 28 16886 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-32D-54 4301333793 5 S 4 W 32 17003 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-14D-54 4301333796 5 S 4 W 14 17482 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-27D-55 4301333797 5 S 5 W 27 16700 Oil Well Producing
FOY TRIBAL 12H-33-55 4301333799 5 S 5 W 33 18232 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-32D-55 4301333800 5 S 5 W 32 18361 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-54 4301333801 5 S 4 W 26 16639 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-26D-55 4301333859 5 S 5 W 26 17859 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL2-34D-54 4301333867 5 S 4 W 34 17889 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-35D-55 4301333888 5 S 5 W 35 17421 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-32-54 4301333902 5 S 4 W 32 16819 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-31D-54 4301333907 5 S 4 W 31 17480 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-23D-55 4301333908 5 S 5 W 23 17814 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-20D-55 4301333909 5 S 5 W 20 18559 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-20D-55 4301333910 5 S 5 W 20 18481 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-20-55 4301333911 5 S 5 W 20 18520 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-24D-55 4301333912 5 S 5 W 24 16943 Oil Well Producin
UTE TRIBAL 14-23D-55 4301333915 5 S 5 W 23 17457 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL 1-15D-54 4301333916 5 S 4 W 15 16889 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL 7-15D-54 4301333950 5 S 4 W 15 16972 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL 9-15D-54 4301333951 5 S 4 W 15 16973 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-35D-55 4301333954 5 S 5 W 35 17417 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-35D-55 4301333955 5 S 5 W 35 17416 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-26D-55 _ 4301333965 5 S 5 W 26 17418 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 1-2D-65 4301333966 6 S 5 W 2 16888 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-35D-55 4301333967 5 S 5 W 35 17420 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10-36D-55 4301333968 5 S 5 W 36 17743 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-26D-55 4301333978 5 S 5 W 26 17455 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-26D-55 4301333979 5 S 5 W 26 17456 Oil Well Producing

21 6/27/201



From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

BERRY TRIBAL 14-23D.54 4301 333989 5 S 4 W 23 17903 OilWell
FEDERAL 3-2D-65 4301 334001 o S 5 W 2 16944 OilWell lroduqiqg

!4t{qcing,_
Producing

UTE TRIBAL 13-26D-55 4301 334002 5
6

S 5 W 26 17481 OilWell
FEDERAL 7-1D-65 4301 33401 s S 5 W 1 17775 OilWell
FEDEML 2-2D-64 4301 33401 I o

6
S 4 W 2 17086 OilWell Producing

FEDERAL 7-6D-64 49ql$4q20
4301 334028

S 4 W 6 17085 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6.35D.55 5 S 5 W 35 17785 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 16.26.54 4301334042 5 S 4 W

W
26 17413 OilWell Producing

BERRY TRIBAL 13.23-54 4301334043 5 S 4 23 17100 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6-28D.55 43013340s6 5 S 5 W 28 18593 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-28-55 4301334057 5 S 5 W 2q-

27
18001 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 8-27D-55 4301334058 5 S 5 W 17842 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 3.15D-54 4301334059 5 S 4 W 15 17477 OilWell Producing
ST TRIBAL 5-15D-54 4301334060 5 S 4 W 15 17479 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 7-11D-65 4301334061 o S 5 W 1',! 17776 OilWell Producing
FEDEML 7-3D€5 4301334065 o S 5 W 3 17',t24 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 9-27D-54 4301 3341 08 5 S 4 W 27 I 9095 OilWell Producing
MOON TRIBAL 16-27D.54 4301334109 5 S 4 W 27 17414 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-220-54 43013341 16 5 S 4 W 22 17415 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-35D-55 4301334',t17 5 S 5 W 35 18442 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-55 43013341 18 5 S 5 W 26

6
17786 OilWell Producing

FEDERAL 11-6D.64 4301334284 o S 4 W 17615 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 14-6D-64 4301 334285 o S 4 W o 't7616 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 2-6D.64 4301 334286 6 S 4 W b 17663 OilWell Producing
FEDEML 3-5D-64 4301334287 6 S 4 W 5 17617 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6-5D-64 430't334288 o

5
S 4 W 5 17649 OilWell Producing

SFW TRIBAL 1O-1OD-54 4301 334295 S 4 W
W
W

10
10
10

17564 OilWell ir.gduci49
ProducingSFW TRIBAL 9-1OD-54 430't334296 5 S 4

4
1756s OilWell

STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 4301 350245 5 S
S

17553 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 6.14D-55 1 350246 5 5 W 't4 17602 OilWell Producing
SFW FEE 15.10-54 4301350247 5 S 4 W

W
1A
5

17566 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 5-5D-64 1 350259 o S 4 17648 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 6.22D-56 4301 350260 5 S 6 W 22 17567 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL'12$D-64 4301 350261 tt S 4 W 6 17618 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 4-5D-64 4301 350263 c s 4 W 5 17661 OilWell Producing
FEpERAL l-6-64
FEDERAL 4€D-64

4301 3s0266 o S 4 W 6 17662 OilWell Producing
4301350267 c S 4 W 6 1 7651 OilWell Producing

FEDERAL 3-6D-64 4301350268 5 S 4 W 6 1 7650 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 56D-64 4301350269 5 S 4 W 6 17652 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 8-6D-64 4301350325 3 S 4 W 6 17664 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 1O-1D-65 4301350326 6 S 5 W 1 18027 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 11.1D-65 4301350327 6 S 5 W 1 18039 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 12.1D-65 4301 350328 6 S 5 W ,| 18040 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 13-1D-65 4301 350329 5 S 5 W 1 18042 OilWell

22 612712017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Iffective:May 1, 2017
BERRY TRIBAL 14-23D-54 4301333989 5 S 4 W 23 17903 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 3-2D-65 4301334001 6 S 5 W 2 16944 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-26D-55 4301334002 5 S 5 W 26 17481 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 7-1D-65 4301334015 6 S 5 W 1 17775 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 2-2D-64 4301334018 6 S 4 W 2 17086 Oil Well Producing
EEDERAL 7-6D-64 ___ 4301334020 6 S 4 W 6 17085 Oil Well Producigg
UTE TRIBAL6-35D-55 4301334028 5 S 5 W 35 17785 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-26-54 4301334042 5 S 4 W 26 17413 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 13-23-54 4301334043 5 S 4 W 23 17100 _ Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-28D-55 4301334056 5 S 5 W 28 18593 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-28-55 4301334057 5 S 5 W 28 18001 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-27D-55 4301334058 5 S 5 W 27 17842 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL 3-15D-54 4301334059 5 S 4 W 15 17477 Oil Well Producing
ST TRIBAL 5-15D-54 4301334060 5 S 4 W 15 17479 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 7-11D-65 4301334061 6 S 5 W 11 17776 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 7-3D-65 4301334065 6 S 5 W 3 17124 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL9-27D-54 4301334108 5 S 4 W 27 19095 Oil Well Producing
MOON TRIBAL 16-27D-54 4301334109 5 S 4 W 27 17414 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-22D-54 4301334116 5 S 4 W 22 17415 Oil Well ProducinŒ
UTE TRIBAL 13-35D-55 4301334117 5 S 5 W 35 18442 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-26D-55 4301334118 5 S 5 W 26 17786 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 11-6D-64 4301334284 6 S 4 W 6 17615 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 14-6D-64 4301334285 6 S 4 W 6 17616 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 2-6D-64 4301334286 6 S 4 W 6 17663 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 3-5D-64 4301334287 6 S 4 W _ 5 17617 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 6-5D-64 4301334288 6 S 4 W 5 17649 Oil Well Producing
SFW TRIBAL 10-10D-54 4301334295 5 S 4 W 10 17564 Oil Well Producing
SFW TRIBAL 9-10D-54 4301334296 5 S 4 W 10 17565 Oil Well Producing
STATE TRIBAL 16-10-54 4301350245 5 S 4 W 10 17553 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-14D-55 4301350246 5 S 5 W 14 17602 Oil Well Producing
SFW FEE 15-10-54 4301350247 5 S 4 W 10 17566 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 5-5D-64 4301350259 6 S 4 W 5 17648 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL6-22D-56 4301350260 5 S 6 W 22 17567 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 12-6D-64 4301350261 6 S 4 W 6 17618 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 4-5D-64 4301350263 6 S 4 W 5 17661 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 1-6-64 4301350266 6 S 4 W 6 17662 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 4-6D-64 4301350267 6 S 4 W 6 17651 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 3-6D-64 4301350268 6 S 4 W 6 17650 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 5-6D-64 4301350269 6 S 4 W 6 17652 Oil Well Producin
FEDERAL 8-6D-64 4301350325 6 S 4 W 6 17664 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 10-1D-65 4301350326 6 S 5 W 1 18027 Oil Well Producin
FEDERAL 11-1D-65 4301350327 6 S 5 W 1 18039 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 12-1D-65 4301350328 6 S 5 W 1 18040 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 13-1D-65 4301350329 6 S 5 W 1 18042 Oil Well Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
ËRective:May 1, 2017
FEDERAL 14-1D-65 4301350330 6 S 5 W 1 18041 Oil Well _ Producing
FEDERAL 13-5D-64 4301350337 6 S 4 VV 5 17714 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 14-5D-64 4301350338 6 S 4 W 5 17715 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 9-1D-65 4301350342 6 S 5 W 1 18026 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 13-6D-64 4301350347 6 S 4 W 6 17619 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 11-5D-64 4301350348 6 S 4 W 5 17690 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 12-5D-64 4301350349 6 S 4 W 5 17713 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 8-1D-65 4301350350 6 S 5 W 1 18025 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-14D-54 4301350389 5 S 4 W 14 17904 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-34D-55 4301350408 5 S 5 W 34 17931 Oil Well Producing
UTE17tlBAL7-14-54 4301350409 5 S 4 VV 14 17924 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-21D-55 43013504Š5 5 _ S 5 W 21 17963 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-34D-55 4301350436 5 S 5 W 34 17952 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-16D-54 4301350475 5 S 4 W 16 17991 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-14D-55 4301350476 5 S 5 W 14 17973 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-15D-55 4301350477 5 S 5 W 15 17974 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-14-55 4301350478 5 S 5 W 14 18002 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-14-55 4301350479 5 S 5 W 14 18021 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-10D-54 4301350488 5 S 4 W 10 18099 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-34-55 4301350510 5 S 5 W 34 17949 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 4-4D-65 4301350521 6 S 5 W 4 18557 Oil Well Producing
FEDEFL4L6-3D-64 4301350522 6 S 4 VV 3 18073 OilVVell Producinig
FEDEFyAL1-1D-64 4301350524 6 S 4 VV 1 18088 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 7-2D-65 _ 4301350525 6 S 5 W 2 18100 Oil Well Producing
BERRY TRIBAL 12-34D-54 4301350527 5 S 4 W 34 17998 _ Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 15-5D-65 4301350553 6 S 5 W 5 18537 Oil VVell Producing
FEDERAL 11-4D-64 4301350565 6 S 4 VV 4 18043 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 6-6D-65 4301350566 6 S 5 W 6 18521 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 3-15D-56 4301350598 5 S 6 W 15 18097 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 9-16D-56 4301350600 5 S 6 W 16 19544 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 16-16D-56 4301350601 5 S 6 VV 16 18165 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 10-16D-56 _ 430 1350602 5 S 6 W 16 18586 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 15-22D-56 4301350606 5 S 6 VV 22 18278 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 5-23D-56 4301350625 5 S 6 VV 23 18285 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 5-14D-56 4301350661 5 S 6 W 14 18219 Oil Well Producing
SFW FEE 14-10D-54 4301350686 5 S 4_ W 10 18070 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 1-22D-56 4301350718 5 S 6 W 22 18101 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 8-2D-65 4301350719 6 S 5 W 2 18614 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 1-2D-64 _ 4301350730 6 S 4 W 2 18585 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 7-2D-64 4301350734 6 S 4 W 2 18584 _ Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 10-6D-64 4301350735 6 S 4 W 6 18162 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 4-3D-64 4301350736 6 S 4 W 3 18621 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 12-3D-64 4301350737 6 S 4 W 3 18620 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 3-21D-56 4301350751 5 S 6 W 21 18462 Oil Well |Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Ëfective:May 1,2017
LCTRIBAL5-21D-56 4301350752 5 S 6 VV 21 18286 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 2-1D-65 4301350759 6 S 5 W 1 18172 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 3-1D-65 4301350760 6 S 5 W 1 18173 Oil Well Producing
FEDEFUAL5-1D-65 4301350761 6 S 5 VV 1 18174 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 9-2D-65 4301350762 6 S 5 W 2 _ 18245 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 11-2D-65 4301350763 6 S 5 W 2 18589 Oil Well Producini
FEDERAL 15-2D-65 4301350764 6 S 5 W 2 18590 Oil VVell Producing
LC TRIBAL 14-14D-56 4301350776 5 S 6 VV 14 18287 Oil Well Producing
I-ÇFEE 2-20D-56 4301350777 5 S 6 W 20 18622 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 12-22D-56 4301350780 5 S 6 W 22 18341 Oil Well Producing
FEDEFLAL3-4D-65 4301350782 6 S 5 VV 4 18556 OilVVell Producing
FEDERAL 6-4D-65 4301350783 6 S 5 W 4 19162 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 12-4D-65 4301350784 6 S 5 W 4 19171 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 14-15D-56 4301350834 5 S 6 W 15 18362 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 71-21D-54 4301350852 5 S 4 W 21 18423 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8L-21D-54 4301350853 5 S 4 W 21 18423 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 10S-21D-54 4301350854 5 S 4 W 21 18423 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-11-54 4301350861 5 S 4 W 11 18775 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 1-28D-56 4301350865 5 S 6 W 28 19575 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL2-28D-56 4301350866 5 S 6 W 28 18592 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 8-28D-56 4301350867 5 S 6 W 28 18342 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL6-27D-56 4301350868 5 S 6 W 27 18480 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 15-23D-56 4301350870 5 S 6 W 23 18410 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 15-26-56 4301350871 5 S 6 W 26 18377 Oil Well Producing
UTETRIBAL 16-11-55 4301350888 5 S 5 VV 11 18707 OilVVell P'roducing
LC TRIBAL2-5D-56 4301350925 5 S 6 W 5 18568 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL2-9D-56 4301350926 5 S 6 VV 9 18425 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE8-29-45 4301350928 4 6 5 VV 29 18313 OilVVell ProduciníL
LCFEE1399-45 4301350929 4 S 5 VV 29 18426 Oil Nell Producing
LC FEE 9-12D-57 4301350963 5 S 7 W 12 18541 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 1-22-57 4301350965 5 S 7 W 22 18558 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-3D-56 4301350966 5 S 6 W 3 18464 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL3-34-45 4301350976 4 S 5 W 34 18661 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL9-10D-56 4301350987 5 S 6 W 10 18944 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 10-9D-56 4301350990 5 S 6 W 9 18864 Oil Well Producing
I-C FEE 10-31D-45 4301350994 4 S 5 W 31 18443 Oil Well Producing
VIEIRA TRIBAL4-4-54 4301350997 5 S 4 W 4 18747 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 10-21-56 4301350999 5 S 6 W 21 18439 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 1-5D-64 4301351012 6 S 4 W 5 18720 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 2-5D-64 4301351013 6 S 4 W 5 18723 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 7-5D-64 4301351014 6 S 4 W 5 18722 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 8-5D-64 4301351015 6 S 4 W 5 18721 Oil Well _ Producing
MYRINTRIBAL 15-10-55 4301351024 5 S 5 W 10 18771 Oil Well Producin 9
LC TRIBAL 15-15D-56 4301351030 5 S 6 W 15 18440 Oil Well Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effective: 201
LC TRIBAL 9-15D-56 4901 391031

4301 351 034
5 S o W 15 18441 OilWell Producinq

LC TRIBAL 6-2845 4 S 5 W 28 18700 OilWell Prg'{uqEg
ProducingFEDERAL 1-12D-65 4301 351 055 o S 5 W 12 18739 OilWell

FEDERAL 8-12D-65 4301351056 o S 5 W 't2 18718
1 8738

OilWell Produg1lg
ProducingFEDERAL 2-12D-65 4301 351 057 6 S 5 12 OilWell

FEDERAL 7.12D.65 4ql3s1!-s8
4301 351 069

6 S 5 W 12 18717 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 8-22D-56 5 S 6 W 22 19233 oilwe!!

OilWell
Producinq

LC TRIBAL 9-17D-56 4301351070 5 S 6 17 18945 Producing
LC TRIBAL 7.2745 4301 351 073 4 S 5 27 18685 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL '11.2445 4301351076 4 s

S
5 W 24 18745 OilWell Producino

FEDERAL 3-12D€5 4301351093 6 5 W 12 18705 OilWell
FEDERAL 4-12D-65 4301351094 o S 5 W

W
12 18704 OilWell Producinq

FEDERAL 5-12D-65 4301351095 o S 5 12
12

18702 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6-12D-65 4301 351 096 6 S 5 W

W
18703 OilWell Producinq

UTE TRIBAL 9-5-54 4301351111 5 S 4 5 18909 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 9.8D-56 4301351112 5 S 6 !ry

W
8 18522 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 4.9-54 4301 351 126 5 S 4 I 19059 OilWell froduqilg
ProducingUTE TRIBAL2-9-54 4301 351 1 28 5 S 4 W 9 18946 OilWell

UTE TRIBAL 1-10-54 4301351 129 5 S 4 !ry
W

10 18879 OilWell !pdqqing
?lq{qclg
Producing

LC TRIBAL 8-3OD-56 4301351 131 5 S 6 30 18539 OilWell
FEDERAL 1.1D-65 410135-ll!2

4301351 143
o S 5 W l

9
1

1862_9_

18947
OilWell

UTE TRIBAL 8-9-54 5 S 4 W OilWell Producing
Producing
Producinq

FEDERAL 15.1D65 4301 351 1 75 6 S 5 W 18654 OilWell
FEDERAL 16-1D€5 4301 351 1 76 6

5
S 5 W 1 1865s OilWell

LC TRIBAL 11-29D-56 4301 351 1 83 S 6 W 29 18873 OilWell Producinq
STATE TRIBAL 8.12.55 4301351 188 5 S 5 W 12 1 8986 OilWell
LC TRIBAL 11-2OD-56 4301 351 I 89 5 S 6 W 20 18819 OilWell
LC FEE 5-20D-56 4301 351 1 90 5 S 6 W 20 18818 OilWell
LC FEE 9-19-56 4301351 192 5 S 6 W 19 1 8596 OilWell Producinq
LC TRIBAL 9-9D-56 4301351 198 5 S 6 W I 18595 OilWell Producing
OWL AND THE HAWK 3-9C5 430',t351214 3 S 5 W I 18649 OilWell

OilWell
Producing

FEDERAL 16-6-64 4301351217 6 S 4 W o 18792 Producino
FEDERAL 9-6D-64 4301351218 o S 4 W 6 18791 OilWell Producinq
FEDERAL 15-6D-64 4301351219 o S 4 W 6 18793 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-17-55 4301351220 5 S 5 W 17 18841 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-3-54 4301351226 5 S 4 W 3 18664 OilWell Producinq
STATE TRIBAL 8-7-54 4301351228 5 S 4 W 7 '18743 OilWell Producinq
STATE TRIBAL 12-1-55 4301351229 5 S 5 W 1-

2
18741 OilWell Producinq

STATE TRIBAL '11.2-55 4301351230 5 S 5 W 18742 OilWell
FEDERAL 1-11-65 4301 351231 EI S 5 W 11

11

18689 OilWell
FEDERAL 8-11D€5 4301351232 5 S 5 W 18688 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 2.11D-65 4301 351233 I S 5 W 11 189e_0*

18744
OilWell

STATE TRIBAL 12-3-55 4301 351236 5 S 5 W _3_
4

OilWell Producing
ProducinoUTE TRIBAL 1't-4-55 43013s1237 5 S 5 W 1 8663 OilWell

6t27t201725

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
iffective:May 1, 2017
LC TRIBAL 9-15D-56 4301351031 5 S 6 W 15 18441 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL6-28-45 4301351034 4 S 5 W 28 18700 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 1-12D-65 __ 4301351055 6 S 5 W 12 18739 _ Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 8-12D-65 4301351056 6 S 5 W 12 18718 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 2-12D-65 4301351057 6 S 5 W 12 18738 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 7-12D-65 4301351058 6 S 5 W 12 18717 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL8-22D-56 4301351069 5 S 6 W 22 19233 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL9-17D-56 4301351070 5 S 6 W 17 18945 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL7-27-45 4301351073 4 S 5 W 27 18685 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-24-45 4301351076 4 S 5 W 24 18745 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 3-12D-65 4301351093 6 S 5 W 12 18705 Oil Well Producing
ËEDERÄL 4-12D-65 4301351094 6 S 5 W 12 18704 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 5-12D-65 4301351095 6 S 5 W 12 18702 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 6-12D-65 4301351096 6 S 5 W 12 18703 _ Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-5-54 4301351111 5 S 4 W 5 18909 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL9-8D-56 4301351112 5 S 6 W 8 18522 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-9-54 4301351126 5 S 4 W 9 19059 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-9-54 4301351128 5 S 4 W 9 18946 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-10-54 4301351129 5 S 4 W 10 18879 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL8-30D-56 4301351131 5 S 6 W 30 18539 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 1-1D-65 4301351142 6 S 5 W 1 18623 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 8-9-54 4301351143 5 S 4 W 9 18947 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 15-1D-65 430951175 6 S 5 W 1 18654 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 16-1D-65 4301351176 6 S 5 W 1 18655 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-29D-56 4301351183 5 S 6 W 29 18873 Oil Well Producing
STATE TRIBAL 8-12-55 4301351188 5 S 5 W 12 18986 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-20D-56 4301351189 5 S 6 W 20 18819 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 5-20D-56 4301351190 5 S 6 W 20 18818 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 9-19-56 4301351192 5 S 6 W 19 18596 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 9-9D-56 4301351198 5 S 6 W 9 18595 Oil Well Producing
OWL AND THE HAWK 3-9C5 4301351214 3 S 5 W 9 18649 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 16-6-64 4301351217 6 S 4 W 6_ 18792 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 9-6D-64 4301351218 6 S 4 W 6 18791 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 15-6D-64 4301351219 6 S 4 W 6 18793 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-17-55 4301351220 5 S 5 W 17 18841 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 16-3-54 4301351226 5 S 4 W 3 18664 Oil Well Producing
STATE TRIBAL 8-7-54 4301351228 5 S 4 W 7 18743 Oil Well Producing
STATE TRIBAL 12-1-55 4301351229 5 S 5 W 1 18741 Oil Well Producing
STATE TRIBAL 11-2-55 4301351230 5 S 5 W 2 18742 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 1-11-65 4301351231 6 S 5 W 11 18689 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 8-11D-65 4301351232 6 S 5 W 11 18688 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 2-11D-65 4301351233 6 S 5 W 11 18690 Oil Well Producing
STATE TRIBAL 12-3-55 _ 4301351236 5 S 5 W 3 18744 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-4-55 4301351237 5 S 5 W 4 18663 Oil Well Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

UTE TRIBAL 9-21D-55
UTE FEE 9.9-54
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6127t2017

¯rom: Linn Operating, LLC
fo: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ffective:May 1, 2017
UTE TRIBAL4-9-55 4301351238 5 S 5 W 9 18796 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15-5-55 4301351239 5 S 5 W 5 18740 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL9-21D-55 4301351258 5 S 5 W 21 19401 Oil Well Producing
UTE FEE 9-9-54 4301351259 5 S 4 W 9 18642 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL4-29-45 4301351260 4 S 5 W 29 18719 Oil Well Producing
UTE FEE 14-9D-54 4301351271 5 S 4 W 9 18684 Oil Well Producing
UTE FEE 15-9D-54 4301351272 5 S 4 W 9 18687 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 10-28D-56 4301351288 5 S 6 W 28 18591 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-16D-54 4301351295 5 S 4 W 16 19003 Oil Well Producing
FEE TRIBAL4-5-54 4301351303 5 S 4 W 5 19187 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 1-26-56 4301351306 5 S 6 W 26 18816 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-16D-54 4301351307 5 S 4 W 16 19060 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL7-22D-56 4301351308 5 S 6 W 22 18795 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL9-22D-56 4301351309 5 S 6 W 22 18794 Oil Well Producing
STATE TRIBAL2-12D-55 4301351310 5 S 5 W 12 19444 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL9-32D-56 4301351316 5 S 6 W 32 19228 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL7-26D-56 4301351319 5 S 6 W 26 18817 Oil Well _ Producing
LC FEE 8-6D-56 _ 4301351342 5 S 6 W 6 18657 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 10-29D-45 4301351343 4 S 5 W 29 18850 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 1-7D-56 4301351344 5 S 6 W 7 18774 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL9-7D-56 4301351346 5 S 6 W 7 18773 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 7-10D-54 4301351365 5 S 4 W 10 19391 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-10D-56 4301351369 5 S 6 W 10 18840 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 1-31D-45 4301351371 4 S 5 _ W 31 18686 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL9-26D-56 4301351381 5 S 6 W 26 19433 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 14-21D-56 4301351384 5 S 6 W 21 18877 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL4-22D-56 4301351385 5 S 6 W 22 18878 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL8-21D-56 4301351392 5 S 6 W 21 18874 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 1-17-55 4301351393 5 S 5 W 17 18848 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL4-33D-45 4301351401 4 S 5 W 33 18853 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 16-21D-56 4301351407 5 S 6 W 21 18875 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-10D-54 4301351411 5 S 4 W 10 _ 19172 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL8-17D-55 4301351413 5 S 5 W 17 19388 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-10D-54 4301351414 5 S 4 W 10 19069 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL2-21D-56 4301351418 5 S 6 W 16 19252 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 1-gD-45 4301351425 4 S 5 W 23 18855 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL2-28D-45 4301351429 4 S 5 W 28 18701 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL9-28D-45 4301351430 4 S 5 W 28 18656 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 1-1-56 4301351458 5 S 6 W 1 18829 Oil Well Producing
LC Tribal 12-32-45 4301351465 4 S 5 W 32 18772 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL2-5-54 4301351520 5 S W 5 18880 Oil Well Producing
LC Tribal 3-32D-45 4301351561 4 S 5 W 32 18842 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL5-15D-56 4301351562 5 S 6 W 15 19253 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 16-36-56 4301351611 5 S 6 W 36 19096 Oil Well Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

7
LC FEE 10-36D-56 301351622 5 S 6 W 36 19583 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 15-34-56 351647 5 S 6 W 34 18962 OilWell Producing
LC TRTBAL ',t5-27-56 4301 351649 5 S 6 W 27 19605 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 11.27D-56 1 351650 5 S 6 W 27 19606 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 1-34D.56 4301 351660 5 S 6 W 34 18988 OilWell Producing

C TRIBAL 2-29D45 1 351 705 4 S 5 W 29 19545 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 13-23-56 301 351 706 5 S 6 W 23 18994 OilWell Prodqging

Producing,
Producing

c FEE 11-23D-56 1351707 5 S 6 W
W

23 18995 OilWell
LC TRIBAL 3.33.56 301 351 71 1 5 S 6 33 19242 OilWell
LC FEE 11-29D45 1351743 4 S 5 W 29 19188 OilWell Producing
LC T^YI.OR FEE 14-22D-56_
LC FEE 4-28D45

301351744 5 S 6 W 22 19508 OilWell Producing
1351745 4 S 5 W 29 18849 OilWell Producing

LC FEE 14-6D-56 301 351 787 5 S 6 W 6 18910 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 15-6-56 1351792 5 S 6 W o 1 9334 OilWell Producing
LC TRIBAL 7-27D-56 301 351 823 5 S 6 W 27 1 9608 OilWell Producing
LC Fee 14-36D-56 1 351 878 5 S 6 W 36 1 9376 OilWell Producing
LC Fee 12-36-56 351883 5 S 6 W 36 19377 OilWell Producing
LC Tribal6-29D-45 301 351 902 4 S 5 W 29 19402 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 6-7-64 301 351 91 5 3

c
S 4 W 7 19117 OilWell Producing

FEDERAL 3-70-64 301 351 916 S 4 W 7 191 15 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 4-7D-64 351917 c S 4 W 7 191 10 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 5-7D.64 4301 351 91 I 6 S 4 W 7

7
1911 1 _____
19139

OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 2-7.64 351919 6 S 4 W OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 1.7D-64 4301 351 920 6 S 4 W 7 19140 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 12-7D-64 1351924 6 S 4 W 7

7
19025 OilWell Producing

FEDERAL 11-7D-64 4301 351 925 6 S 4 W 19039 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 13-7D.64 301 351 926 6 S 4 W 7_

7
19026 OilWell Producing

FEDERAL 14-7D-64 35',t927 6 S 4 W 19040 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 7.7D.64 301351933 6 S 4 W 7 19141 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 8-7D€4 301351934 6 S 4 W 7 19142 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 9-7D$4 4301 351 935 6 S 4 W 7 19143 OilWell Producing
FEDERAL 10.7D-64 1351936 6 S 4 W 7 19144 OilWell Producing
ABBOTT FEE 6-6-54 4301351948 5 S 4 W 6 18963 OilWell Producing
ABBOTT FEE 2€D-54 1351949 5 S 4 W 6 18974 OilWell Producing
ABBOTT FEE 4€-54 4301 351 952 5 S 4 W 6 18965 OilWell Producing
FederalT-9D-64 4lqlE]990

4301351992
b S 4 W I 19721 OilWell Producing

Federal 15-12D-65 o S 5 W 12 19051 OilWell Producing
Federal 10-12D-65 1 351 999 c S 5 W 12 19052 OilWell Producing
Federal9-12D-65 4301 352000 c S 5 W 12 19053 OilWell Producing
Federal 16-12D-65 1 352003 5 S 5 W 12 19054 OilWell Producing
Federal4-6D-65 301 352005 5 S 5 W 6 19173 OilWell Producing
Federal 12-6D-65 I 352006 5 S 5 W 6 19174 OilWell Producing
Federal 1€D-65 301352012 5 S 5 W 6 19189 OilWell Producing
Federal3€D65 13520',t4 5 S 5 W o 19190 OilWell Producino

27 6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
:Hective:May 1, 2017
LC FEE 10l-36D-56 4301351622 5 S 6 \4 36 19583 OilVVell Producing
LC TRIBAL 15-34-56 4301351647 5 S 6 W 34 18962 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 15-27-56 4301351649 5 S 6 W 27 19605 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL 11-27D-56 4301351650 5 S 6 W 27 19606 Oil Well Producing
LCTRIBAL1-34D-56 4301351660 5 S 6 VV 34 18988 Oil\¾ell Producing
LC TRIBAL2-29D-45 4301351705 4 S 5 W 29 19545 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 13-23-56 4301351706 5 S 6 W 23 18994 Oil Well Producin 9
LC FEE 11-23D-56 _ 4301351707 5 S 6 W 23 18995 Oil Well Producing
LC TRIBAL3-33-56 4301351711 5 S 6 W 33 19242 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 11-29D-45 4301351743 4 S 5 W 29 19188 Oil Well Producing
LCTAYLCHRFEE 14-220-56 4301351744 5 S 6 VV 22 19508 OilVVell Producing
LC FEE 4-28D-45 4301351745 4 S 5 W 29 18849 Oil Well Producing
LC FEE 14-6D-56 4301351787 5 S 6 VV 6 18910 OilkVell Producing
LCFEE15-6-56 4301351792 5 S 6 VV 6 19334 OilkVell Producing
LCTTRIBAL7-27D-56 4301351823 5 S 6 VV 27 19608 OilVVell Producing
LC Fee 14-36D-56 4301351878 5 S 6 W 36 19376 Oil Well Producing
LC Fee 12-36-56 4301351883 5 S 6 W 36 19377 Oil Well Producing
LC Tribal 6-29D-45 4301351902 4 S 5 W 29 19402 Oil Well Producing
FEDEFVrL6-7-64 4301351915 6 S 4 VV 7 19117 Oil\¾ell Jyoducing
FEDERAL 3-7D-64 4301351916 6 S 4 W 7 19115 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 4-7D-64 4301351917 6 S 4 W 7 19110 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 5-7D-64 4301351918 6 S 4 W 7 19111 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 2-7-64 4301351919 6 S 4 W 7 19139 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 1-7D-64 4301351920 6 S 4 W 7 19140 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 12-7D-64 4301351924 6 S 4 W 7 19025 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 11-7D-64 4301351925 6 S 4 W 7 19039 Oil Well Producing
FEDEFLAL13-7D-64 4301351926 6 S 4 VV 7 19026 OilVVell Producin 9
FEDERAL 14-7D-64 4301351927 6 S 4 W 7 19040 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 7-7D-64 4301351933 6 S 4 W 7 19141 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 8-7D-64 4301351934 6 S 4 W 7 19142 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 9-7D-64 4301351935 6 S 4 W 7 19143 Oil Well Producing
FEDERAL 10-7D-64 4301351936 6 S 4 W 7 19144 Oil Well Producing
ABBOTT FEE 6-6-54 4301351948 5 S 4 W 6 18963 Oil Well Producing
ABBOTT FEE 2-6D-54 4301351949 5 S 4 W 6 18974 Oil Well Producing
ABBOTT FEE 4-6-54 4301351952 5 S 4 W 6 18965 Oil Well Producing
Federal 7-9D-64 4301351990 6 S 4 W _ 9 19721 Oil Well Producing
Federal 15-12D-65 4301351992 6 S 5 W 12 19051 Oil Well Producing
Federal 10-12D-65 4301351999 6 S 5 W 12 19052 Oil Well Producing
Federal 9-12D-65 4301352000 6 S 5 W 12 19053 Oil Well Producing
Federal16-12D-65 4301352003 6 S 5 VV 12 19054 OilVVell Producing
Federal 4-6D-65 4301352005 6 S 5 W 6 19173 Oil Well Producing
Federal 12-6D-65 4301352006 6 S 5 W 6 19174 Oil Well Producing
Federal 1-6D-65 4301352012 6 S 5 W 6 19189 Oil Well Producing
Fedenal3dSDA35 4301352014 6 S 5 VV 6 19190 OilVVell Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

Federal3-9D€4 4301 35201 5 o S 4 W I I 9678
19:19:!

19192

OilWell Producing
Federal2-6€5 4301352011

4301352018
o S 5 W q

6
OilWell Producing

FederalT€D€s 6 S 5 W OilWell Producing
Federal6-9-64 1301?s2921

430',t352023
6 S 4 W I 1 9679 OilWell Producing

FederalS-9D-64 6
o

S 4 W I 19723 OilWell Producing
FederalS-9D64 t9q9q2Q_q

4301352037
S 4 W I 19680 OilWell Producing

Federal 11-9D64 6 S 4 W I 't9687 OilWell Producing
Federal 12-9D-64 4301352038 6 s 4 W o 19688 OilWell Producing
Federal 13-9D€4 4_3_9lL9q?Qq

4301352042
o S 4 W I 19689 OilWell Producing

Federal2-9D-64 o s 1_
5

W I 19724 OilWell Producing
Federal 16-11D€5 4301352045 o S W 11 19070 OilWell Producing
Federal 15-11D65 4301352046 o S 5_

5
W 11 19076 OilWell Producing

Federal 10-1'lD-65 4301352047 6 S W 11 19077 OilWell Producing
Federal 9-11D-65 301 352048 o S 5 W 1',l 19071 Well Producing
Federal 11-12D-65 352049 6 S I

5
W 'l.2 19121 Well cfgdqqjng

ProducingFederal 12-12D-65 4301 352050 6 S W 12 19122 Well
Federal 13-12D-65 4301 352052 6 S 5 W 12 19123 OilWell Producing
Federal 14-12DSs 4301 352053 o S 5 W 12 19124 OilWell Producing
LC Tribal 12-28045 1 352089 4 S 5 W 28

32
32

19378 Well Producing
LC Tribal 2-32D45 4301352113 4 S 5 W 19348 OilWell Producing
LC Tribal 16-29D-45 1352114 4 S 5 W 19349 OilWell Producing
Vieira Tribal3-4D-54 a3_01352',\l

4301352146
5 S 4 W I

4
19210 OilWell Producing

Vieira Tribal54D-54 5
5

S 4 W 19193 OilWell Producing
Vieira Tribal6-4D-54 4301352147 S 4 W 4 19216 OilWell Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 6-3D-54 4301352',t48

4301352',t49
5 S 4 W 3 19289

19290
OilWell Producing

Lamplugh Tribal 5-3D-54 q

5
S W 3 Gas Well Producing

Lamplugh Tribal 4-3D-54 4301352't50
4301352151

S
S

i4
4

W 3 19291 OilWell Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 3-3D-54 5 W 3 19292 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal6-35D-54 4301 3521 58 5 S I

4
W 35 19254 Gas Well Producing

UTE Tribal4-35D-54 4301 3521 59 5 S W 35 19255 Gas Well Producing
Heiner Tribal 3-11D-54 4301 352165 5 S I

4
W 11 19194 OilWell Producing

Heiner Tribal 4-11-54 4301352166 5 S W 11 19195 OilWell Producing
Heiner Tribal 5-11D-54 4301352',t67 5 S 1_

4
W 11 19196 OilWell Producing

Conolly Tribal 1-1 1 D-54 4301 352168 5 S W 11 19270 OilWell Producing
Conolly Tribal 2-1 1 D-54 4301 352169 5 S 4 W 11 19197 OilWell Producing
Conolly Tribal 7-1 1 D-54 1?91352170

4301352171
5 S 4 W 11 19280 OilWell Producing

Conolly Tribal 8-1 1 D-54 5 S 4 W 11 19281 OilWell Producing
Casper Tribal 1-5D-54 4301 3521 80 5 S 4 W 5 19198 OilWell Producing
Fee Tribal6-5D-54 430135218',1 5 S 4 W

W
5
5

19199 OilWell Producing
Fee Tribal 5-5D-54 430',t352182 5 S 4 19200 OilWell Producing
Fee Tribal 3-5D-54 4301352184 5 S 4 W 5 19201 OilWell Ppdqqlng

ProducingCas er Tribal 7-5D-54 4301 3521 85 5 S 4 W 5 19202 OilWell
UTE Tribal 10-35D-54 4301352198 5 S 4 W 35 19320 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 14-35D-54 4301352199 5 S 4 W 35 1931 1 Gas Well Producino

28 6t27t20',t7

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Ifective:May 1, 2017
Federal 3-9D-64 4301352015 6 S 4 W 9 19678 Oil Well Producing
Fedenal2-6-ß5 4301352017 6 S 5 VV 6 19191 OilVVell P'roducing
Federal 7-6D-65 4301352018 6 S 5 W 6 19192 Oil Well Producing
Federal6-944 4301352021 6 S 4 VV 9 19679 OilVVell Producing
Federal 8-9D-64 4301352023 6 S 4 W 9 19723 Oil VVell Producing
Federal 5-9D-64 4301352035 6 S 4 W 9 19680 _ Oil Well Producing
Fedenal11-9D-64 4301352037 6 S 4 VV 9 19687 OilVVell Producing
Federal 12-9D-64 4301352038 6 S 4 W 9 19688 Oil Well Producing
Federal 13-9D-64 4301352039 6 S 4 W 9 19689 Oil Well Producing
Fedenal2-9D-64 4301352042 6 S 4 VV 9 19724 Oil\Nell Producing
Federal 16-11D-65 4301352045 6 S 5 W 11 19070 Oil Well Producing
Federal 15-11D-65 4301352046 6 S 5 W 11 19076 Oil Well Producing
Federal10-110-65 4301352047 6 S 5 VV 11 19077 OilVVell Producing;
Federal9-11D-65 4301352048 6 S 5 VV 11 19071 OilVVell Produciryt
Federal11-12D-65 4301352049 6 S 5 VV 12 19121 OilVVell Producin 9
Fedenal12-12D-65 _ 4301352050 6 S 5 VV 12 19122 OilVVell Producina
Federal 13-12D-65 4301352052 6 S 5 W 12 19123 Oil Well Producing
Federal14-12D-65 4301352053 6 S 5 VV 12 19124 OilVVell Producing
LC Tribal 12-28D-45 4301352089 4 S 5 W 28 19378 Oil Well Producing
LC Tribal 2-32D-45 4301352113 4 S 5 W 32 19348 Oil Well Producing
LC Tribal 16-29D-45 4301352114 4 S 5 W 32 19349 Oil Well Producing
Vieira Tribal 3-4D-54 4301352145 5 S 4 W 4 19210 Oil Well_ Producing
VieiraTribal5-4D-54 4301352146 5 S 4 VV 4 19193 OilVVell P'roducing
VieiraTribal6-4D-5.4 4301352147 5 S 4 VV 4 19216 OilVVell Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 6-3D-54 4301352148 5 S 4 W 3 19289 Oil Well Producing
I-amplugh Tribal 5-3D-54 4301352149 5 S 4 W 3 19290 Gas Well Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 4-3D-54 4301352150 5 S 4 W 3 19291 Oil VVell Producing
Lamplugh Tribal 3-3D-54 4301352151 5 S 4 W 3 19292 Oil Well Producing
UTE Tribal 6-35D-54 4301352158 5 S 4 VV 35 19254 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 4-35D-54 4301352159 5 S 4 W 35 19255 Gas Well Producing
Heiner Tribal 3-11D-54 4301352165 5 S 4 W 11 19194 Oil Well Producing
Heiner Tribal 4-11-54 4301352166 5 S 4 W 11 19195 Oil Well Producin 9
Heiner Tribal 5-11D-54 4301352167 5 S 4 W 11 19196 Oil VVell Producing
Conolly Tribal 1-11D-54 4301352168 5 S 4 W 11 19270 Oil Well Producing
Conolly Tribal 2-11D-54 4301352169 5 S 4 VV 11 19197 Oil Well Producing
Conolly Tribal 7-11D-54 4301352170 5 S 4 VV 11 19280 Oil Well Producing
Conolly Tribal 8-11D-54 4301352171 5 S 4 VV 11 19281 Oil We11 Producing
CasperTribal1-5D-5.4 4301352180 5 S 4 VV 5 19198 OilvVell Producing
Fee Tribal 6-5D-54 4301352181 5 S 4 W 5 19199 Oil Well Producing
Fee Tribal 5-5D-54 4301352182 5 S 4 W 5 19200 Oil Well Producing
Fee Tribal 3-5D-54 4301352184 5 S 4 W 5 19201 Oil Well Producing
Casper Tribal 7-5D-54 4301352185 5 S 4 W 5 19202 Oil Well Producing
UTE Tribal 10-35D-54 4301352198 5 S 4 W 35 19320 Oil Well Producing
UTE Tribal 14-35D-54 4301352199 5 S 4 W 35 19311 Gas Well Producing

28



From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

UTE Tribal 12-35D-54 19Q:!3_92?0,0
4301352213

5 S 4 W 35 19312 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 14-18D-54 5 S 4 W 18 19509 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 16-35D-54 4301352230 5 S 4 W 35

3
19321 OilWell Producing

Evans Tribal 1-3-54 4301352234 5 S 4 W 19264 OilWell Producing
Evans Tribal 2-3D-54 4301352235 5 S 4 W

W
3
3

19265 OilWell Producing
Evans Tribal 7-3D-54 4301 352236 5 S 4 19256 OilWell P_roducing

ProducingEvans Tribal 8-3D-54 4301352237 5 S 4 W 3 '19_257

19236
19:237

19238

OilWell
Ule Trlbal9-3D-54
Ute Tribal 15-3D-54

43013s2249
qsotiszzso

5
5

S
S

4
4

W
W

3
3

OilWell
OilWell

Pqodgcing
Producing

Ute Tribal 10-3-54 43013s2251 5 S 4 W 3
3

OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 14-3D-54 43013s2298 5 S 4 W 19258 oi Well Producing
Ute Tribal 12-30-54 4301352299 5 S 4 W 3 19259 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 11-3D-54 4301 352300 5 S 4 W 3 19260 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 164D-54 430',t352302 5 S 4 W 4 19350 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 154D-54 4301352303 5 S 4 W 4 19293 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 94D-54 4301352305 5 S 4 W 4 19304 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 10.4D-54 4301352307 5 S 4 W 4 't9294 OilWell Producing
UTE Tribal 15-31D-55 4301352309 5 S 5 W 31 19472 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 16-31D-55 4301352318 5 S 5 W 31 't9473 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal2-35D-54 4301352319 5 S 4 W 35 19322 OilWell
UTE Tribal 8-35D-54 {3q_1_352320

4301352326
5 S 4 W 35 19323 OilWell Producinq

Abbott Fee 5-6D-54 5 S 4
W

19351 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 6-11D-54 4301352330 5 S 4 11

11

'19243 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 12-11D-54 4301352331 5 S 4 19244 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 14-11D-54 430',t352332 5 S 4 11 19245 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 1'l4D-54 4301352343 5 S 4 4 19305 OilWell Producing _

ProducingUte Tribal 13*4D-54 43q352349
430't352346

5 S 4 19353 OilWell
Ute Tribal 144D-54 5

5
S 4 4 1e306

19651
OilWell Producinq

State Tribal 7-'l2O-55 4301352369 S 5 1zl
12
6

OilWell Producing
State Tribal 1-12D-55 43!]3s2399

43013!2394
4301352396

5 S 5 19445 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 16-6D-54 5 S 4 19424 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 9€D-54 5 S 4 W 19426 OilWell Producing
State TribalT-7D-54 430',t352426 5 S 4 7 19496 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 1-7D-54 4301352427 5 S 4 7 19497 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 2-7D-54 4301352428 5 S 4 7 19498 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 3-7D-54 4301352429 5 S 4 7 19517 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 4-7D-54 4301352431 5 S 4 7 19546 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 5-7D-54 4301352432 5 S 4 W 7 19547 OilWell Producing
State Tribal6-7D-54 4301 352433 5 S 4 W 7 19518 OilWell Producino
State Tribal 116D-54 4301352452 5 S 4 W o 19474 OilWell Producinq
State Tribal 12$D-54 4301 352453 5 S 4 W 6 19475 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 13€D-54 4301352454 5 S 4 W 6 19476 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 1-9D-54 4301 352465 5 S 4 W I 19356 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 7-9D-54 4301 352466 5 s 4 W 9 19357 OilWell Producino

29 6t27t2017

-rom: Linn Operating, LLC
fo: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Ëñective:May 1, 2017
UTE Tribal 12-35D-54 4301352200 5 S 4 W 35 19312 Oil VVell Producing
LifETribal14-18D-54 4301352213 5 S 4 VV 18 19509 GiasVVell Producirg;
LTTETribal16-350-54 4301352230 5 S 4 VV 35 19321 OilVVell Producing
Evans Tribal 1-3-54 4301352234 5 S 4 W 3 19264 Oil VVell Producing
Evans Tribal 2-3D-54 4301352235 5 S 4 W 3 19265 Oil Well Producing
Evans Tribal 7-3D-54 4301352236 5 S 4 VV 3 19256 Oil VVell Producing
Evans Tribal 8-3D-54 4301352237 5 S 4 W 3 19257 Oil Well Producing
UteTribal9-3D-54 4301352249 5 S 4 VV 3 19236 OilVVell Producing
Ute Tribal 15-3D-54 4301352250 5 S 4 W 3 19237 Oil Well Producing
UteTribal10-3-54 4301352251 5 S 4 VV 3 19238 OilVVell Produciry;
UteTritual14-3D-54 4301352298 5 S 4 VV 3 19258 OilVVell Producinig
Ute Tribal 12-3D-54 4301352299 5 S 4 W 3 19259 Oil Well Producing
UteTribal11-3D-54 4301352300 5 S 4 VV 3 19260 OilVVell Producirug
UteTribal16-4D-54 4301352302 5 S 4 VV 4 19350 OilVVell Producing
UteTribal15-4D-54 4301352303 5 S 4 VV 4 19293 OilVVell P'roduciršL
Ute Tribal 9-4D-54 4301352305 5 S 4 W 4 19304 Oil Well Producing
UteTribal104D-54 4301352307 5 S 4 VV 4 19294 Oil\¾ell Producing
UTETritxal15-31D-55 4301352309 5 S 5 VV 31 19472 GasVVell Producirgi
UTE Tribal 16-31D-55 4301352318 5 S 5 W 31 19473 Gas Well Producing
UTE Tribal 2-35D-54 4301352319 5 S 4 W 35 19322 Oil Well Producing
UTE Tribal 8-35D-54 _ 4301352320 5 S 4 W 35 19323 Oil Well Producing
AbbottFee5-6D-54 4301352326 5 S 4 VV 6 19351 Oil\¾ell Producing
UteTribal6-110-54 4301352330 5 S 4 VV 11 19243 OilVVell Producing
Ute Tribal 12-11D-54 4301352331 5 S 4 _ W 11 19244 Oil Well Producing
Ute Tribal 14-11D-54 4301352332 5 S 4 W 11 19245 Oil VVell Producing
UteTribal11-H3-54 4301352343 5 S 4 VV 4 19305 Oiltvell Producing
Ute Tribal 13-4D-54 4301352345 5 S 4 VV 4 1 53 Oi Well Producing
Ute Tribal 14-4D-54 4301352346 5 S 4 VV 4 19306 Oil VVell Producing
State Tribal 7-12D-55 4301352369 5 S 5 W 12 19651 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 1-12D-55 4301352390 5 S 5 VV 12 19445 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 16-6D-? 4301352394 5 S 4 VV 6 19424 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 9-6D-54 4301352396 5 S 4 W 6 19426 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 7-7D-54 4301352426 5 S 4 IW 7 19496 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 1-7D-54 4301352427 5 S 4 W 7 19497 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 2-7D-54 4301352428 5 S 4 W 7 19498 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 3-7D-54 4301352429 5 S 4 W 7 19517 Oil VVell Producing
State Tribal 4-7D-54 4301352431 5 S 4 W 7 19546 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 5-7D-54 4301352432 5 S 4 W 7 19547 Oil Well Producit
State Tribal 6-7D-54 4301352433 5 S 4 W 7 19518 Oil Well Producing
SitateTribal11-6D-54 4301352452 5 S 4 VV 6 19474 OilVVell Produciry)
State Tribal 12-6D-54 4301352453 5 S 4 W 6 19475 Oil Well Producing
StateTritual13-BD-54 4301352454 5 S 4 VV 6 19476 OilVVell Produciry;
UteTribal1-9D-54 4301352465 5 S 4 VV 9 19356 OilVVell Producing
UteTiibal7-9D-54 4301352466 5 S 4 VV 9 19357 OilVVell P'roducing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

1.201
UTE TRIBAL 12-5D-54 4301352480 5 S t

4
W 5 19499 OilWell Producing

UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-54
UTE TRIBAL 14-5D.54

4301352484 5 S W 5
q
o
6

19500 OilWell Producing
1 352493 5 S 4 W 19510 OilWell Producinq

Federal 14-6D-65 301 352495 6 S 5 W 19610 OilWell Producing
Federal 136D€5 1 352496 6 s 5 1961 1 OilWell Producinq
Federal 116D65 30't352497 6 S 5

4
4

W o 19591 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 16-5D-54 1352545 5 S 5 19335 OilWell Producing
Ute Tribal 15-5D-54 4,3ql3l?q4q

4301352547
5 S W 5 19358 Q!!well

OilWell
Producing
ProducinqUte Tribal 10-5D-54 5 S 4 W 5 19359

Ute Tribal 8-5D-54 352548 5 S 4 W
W

5 19336 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 13-11D-54 4301 352561 5 S 4 10 19519 OilWell Pfqduqtlg _

irodqq4g _
Producj4g

State Tribal 1-18D-54 4301 352568 5 S 4 W 18 19!34 -
19427

OilWell
State Tribal 2-18D-54 4301 352576 5 S 4 W 18 OilWell
State Tribal 8-18D-54 4301352577 5 S 4 W 18 19428 OilWell Producing
Federal 166D-65 4301 352590 6 S 5 W 't9616 OilWell Producing
Federal 15-6D-65 4301 352591 o S 5 W 19617 OilWell Producing
State Tribal4-18D-54 4301352607 5 S 4 W 18 19435 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 3-18D-54 13019!4608

4301 352609
5 S 4 W 18 a4qq

19437
OilWell Producing

State Tribal6-18D-54 5 S 4 W 18 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 5-12-55 4301 352643 5 S 5 W 12 19446 OilWell Producinq
State Tribal 12-'l2D-55 4qqs?6_41

4301352645
5 S 5 W 12

12
19447 OilWell Producing

State Tribal6-12D-55 5 S 5 W 19438 OilWell ?rqdseus
ProducingState Tribal 16-1D-55 4301352646 5 S 5 W 1 19483 OilWell

State Tribal 15-1D-55 4301352647 5 s 5
5

W 1

1

1

19484 OilWell Producing
State Tribal 10-1D-55 4301352648 5 S W 19485 OilWell Producing
State Tribal9-1D-55 4301352649 5 S 5 W 19486 OilWell Producing
LC FEE 16-15D-56 4301352655 5_

5
S 6 W 14 19520 OilWell Producing

LC Tribal2-22D-56 4301352663 S o W 22 't9548 OilWell Plodugi4g
ProducingLC Tribal 3-22D-56 4301352664 5 S 6 W 22 19549 OilWell

UTE TRIBAL 14-3OD-55 4301352687 5 S 5 W 30 19836 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13.30D-55 4301352688 5 S 5 W 30 19743 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-3OD-55 4301352689 5 S 5 W 30 19744 OilWell Producino
UTE TRIBAL 11.30D-55

-43q1352q9q
4301352699

5 S
S

5 W 30 1e'74.s

19774
OilWell Producinq

UTE TRIBAL 12-31D.55 5 5 W 31 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-31D-55 4301 352700 5 S 5 W 31 19775 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 14-31D.55 4301352701 5 S 5 W 31 19776 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-31-55 4301 352703 5 S 5 W 31 19777 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 9.30D-55 4301352731 5 S 5 W 30 19732 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 15.30D.55 4301352737 5 S 5 W 30 19725 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-31D-55 4301352757 5 S 5 W 31 19778 OilWell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-31D-55 4301352758 5 S 5 W 31 19779 OilWell Producinq
UTE TRIBAL 6-31D-55 43013s2759 5 S 5 W 31 19746 OilWell Producing
FederalS-14D-65 4301352767 6 S 5 W 14 19592 OilWell Producino
FederalT-14D-65 4301352768 6 S 5 W 't4 19593 OilWell

30 6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ñective:May 1,2017
UTE TRIBAL 12-5D-54 4301352480 5 S 4 W 5 19499 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-5D-54 4301352484 5 S 4 W 5 19500 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-5D-54 4301352493 5 S 4 W 5 19510 Oil Well Producing
Federal 14-6D-65 4301352495 6 S 5 W 6 19610 Oil Well Producing
Federal 13-6D-65 4301352496 6 S 5 W 6_ 19611 Oil Well Producing
Federal1143D-65 4301352497 6 S 5 \N 6 19591 Oiltvell Producing
Ute Tribal 16-5D-54 4301352545 5 S 4 W 5 19335 Oil Well Producing
Ute Tribal 15-5D-54 4301352546 5 S 4 W 5 19358 Oil Well Producing
Ute Tribal 10-5D-54 4301352547 5 S 4 W 5 19359 Oil Well Producing
Ute Tribal 8-5D-54 4301352548 5 S 4 W 5 19336 Oil VVell Producing
State Tribal 13-11D-54 4301352561 5 S 4 W 10 19519 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 1-18D-54 4301352568 5 S 4 W 18 19434 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 2-18D-54 4301352576 5 S 4 W 18 19427 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 8-18D-54 4301352577 5 S 4 VV 18 19428 _ Oil Well Producing
Federal164D-65 4301352590 6 S 5 VV 6 19616 Oil\Neg Producing
Federal 15-6D-65 4301352591 6 S 5 W 6 19617 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 4-18D-54 4301352607 5 S 4 W 18 19435 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 3-18D-54 _ 4301352608 5 S 4 W 18 19436 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 6-18D-54 4301352609 5 S 4 W 18 19437 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 5-12-55 4301352643 5 S 5 W 12 19446 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 12-12D-55 4301352644 5 S 5 W 12 19447 Oil Well _ Producing
State Tribal 6-12D-55 4301352645 5 S 5 W 12 19438 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 16-1D-55 4301352646 5 S 5 W 1 19483 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 15-1D-55 4301352647 5 S 5 W 1 19484 Oil Well Producing
State Tribal 10-1D-55 4301352648 5 S 5 W 1 19485 Oil Well Producing
SitateTritral9-1D-55 4301352649 5 S 5 VV 1 19486 OilVVell Producing
LC FEE 16-15D-56 4301352655 5 S 6 W 14 19520 Oil Well Producing
LC Tribal 2-22D-56 4301352663 5 S 6 W 22 19548 Oil Well Producing
LC Tribal 3-22D-56 4301352664 5 S 6_ VV 22 19549 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-30D-55 4301352687 5 S 5 W 30 19836 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-30D-55 4301352688 5 S 5 W 30 19743 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 12-30D-55 4301352689 5 S 5 W 30 19744 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-30D-55 4301352690 5 S 5 W 30 19745 Oil Well Producin
lJTE TRIBAL 12-31D-55 4301352699 5 S 5 W 31 19774 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 13-31D-55 4301352700 5 S 5 W 31 19775 Oil Well_ _ Producing
UTE TRIBAL 14-31D-55 4301352701 5 S 5 W 31 19776 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 11-31-55 4301352703 5 S 5 W 31 19777 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 9-30D-55 4301352731 5 S 5 W 30 19732 Oil Well Producing
UTETTRIBAL15-300-55 4301352737 5 S 5 VV 30 19725 OilVVell Producing
UTE TRIBAL 3-31D-55 4301352757 5 S 5 W 31 19778 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL 5-31D-55 4301352758 5 S 5 W 31 19779 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL6-31D-55 4301352759 5 S 5 W 31 19746 Oil Well Producing
Federal 8-14D-65 4301352767 6 S 5 W 14 19592 Oil Well Producing
Federal7-14D-65 4301352768 6 S 5 VV 14 19593 Oil\Nell Producing
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

4301351738LC TRIBAL 4H-31-56
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4301352325
LC Fee 9-1 1 D-56

Williams Tribal 7-4D-54
Williams Tribal24D-54

Foy Fee 5-34D:55

UTE FEE 1O-13D-55
LC Tribal 10-15D-56
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4300731001

6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ñective:May1,2017
Federal 2-14D-65 4301352769 6 S 5 W 14 19594 Oil Well Producing
Federal 1-14D-65 4301352770 6 S 5 W 14 19595 Oil Well Producing
UTE TRIBAL4-31D-55 4301352795 5 S 5 W 31 19780 Oil VVell Producing
Fedenal1-13D-65 4301352800 6 S 5 VV 13 19596 OilVVell Producing
Federal2-13-65 4301352801 6 S 5 VV 13 19501 OilVVell Producinig
Federal 7-13D-65 4301352802 6 S 5 VV 13 19597 Oil Well Producing
Federal 8-13D-65 4301352803 6 S 5 W 13 19502 Oil Well Producing
Federal12-8D-64 4301352832 6 S 4 VV 7 1j 550 OilVVell Producinji
Federal5-8D-6·4 4301352833 6 S 4 VV 7 19551 OilVVell Producing
Federal 4-8D-64 4301352834 6 S 4 W 7 19552 Oil Well Producing
Federal3-8D-6.4 4301352845 6 S 4 VV 5 19503 OilVVell Pnyducing
LC TRIBAL4H-31-56 4301351738 5 S 6 W 31 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Fee 11-22-57 4301352127 5 S 7 W 22 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Fee 13-22D-57 4301352131 5 S 7 VV 22 OilVVell RetuntedAPD(Unapproved)
LCTribal5-22D-57 _ 4301352133 5 S 7 VV 22 OilVVell ReturnedAPD(Unappnavexi)
LC Tribal 15-22D-57 4301352134 5 S 7 W 22 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 11-18D-56 4301352140 5 S 6 W 18 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 13-18D-56 4301352141 5 S 6 W 18 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapprovedì
LC Tribal 15-18D-56 4301352142 5 S 6 W 18 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal7-18D-56 4301352153 5 S 6 VV 18 OilVVell ReturnedAPD(Unapproved)
LC Tribal 5-18D-56 4301352154 5 S 6 W 18 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 3-18-56 4301352155 5 S 6 W 18 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 6-19D-56 4301352247 5 S 6 W _ 19 Oil VVell Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 4-19D-56 4301352248 5 S 6 W 19 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
Abbott Fee 3-6D-54 4301352325 5 S 4 W 6 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Fee 9-11D-56 4301352479 5 S 6 W 11 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams Tribal 8-4D-54 4301352650 5 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams Tribal 7-4D-54 4301352651 5 S 4 VV 4 Oil VVell Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams Tribal 2-4D-54 4301352652 5 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
Williams Tribal 1-4D-54 4301352653 5 S 4 W 4 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
Foy Fee 12-34D-55 4301353087 5 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
foy Fee 6-34D-55 4301353088 5 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
Foy Fee 5-34D-55 4301353089 5 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
FoyFee3-34D-55 4301353090 5 S 5 VV 34 OilVVell ReturnedAPD(Unappngved)
Foy Tribal 13-34D-55 4301353119 5 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
Foy Tribal 14-34-55 4301353120 5 S 5 W 34 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
UTE FEE 10-13D-55 4301353129 5 S 5 W 13 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 10-15D-56 4301353163 5 S 6 W 15 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 9-21D-56 4301353164 5 S 6 W 21 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 7-21D-56 4301353165 5 S 6 W 21 Oil Well Returned APD (Unapproved)
LC Tribal 11-15D-56 4301353189 5 S 6 W 15 Oil Well Returned APD Unapproved)
SCOFIELD THORPE 22-41X RIG SKID 4300730890 12 S 7 E 22 13719 Gas Well Shut-in
SCOFIELD-THORPE 35-13_ 4300730991 12 S 7 E 35 14846 Gas VVell Shut-in
SCOFIELD-THORPE 23-31 4300731001 12 S 7 E 23 14923 Gas Well Shut-in
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
Effective: 201
W]RE FENCE CYN FED 15-1 4301330404 o S 5 W 15 8233 Gas Well Shut-in
R FORK ANTELOPE CYN FED 25-1 4301330406 6 S 5 W 25 8234 OilWell Shut-in
WOLF HOLLOW 22-1 4301330425 6 S 5 W 22 10370 Gas Well Shut-in
Z andT UTE TRIBAL 12-22 4301 331 31 1 5 S 4 W 22 11421 _o:il_Welt _

OilWell
Shut-in

UTE TRIBAL 15.17 4301331649 5_

5
S 4 W 17 1 19s6 Shut-in

UTE TRIBAL 3-19 4301331830 S 4 W 19 12197 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 14-17 430',t332147 5 S 4 W 17 12755 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 7.30 4301332167 5 S 4 W 30 12945 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1-33 4301 3321 85 5 S 4 W 33 13024 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 5-24-55 4301332263 5 S 5 W 24 1362',1 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1O-16-55 4301332345 5 S 5 W l6

30
21

13693 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 15-30-54 430',t332382 5 S 4 W 13944 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 14.21.54 4301332384 5 S 4 W 13946 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 13-30-54 4301332409 5 S 4 W 30 1 3968 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54 4301332412 5 S 4 W 33 1 3938 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1-20-55 4301332414 5 S 5 W 20 14548 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 9.29.54 4301 332566 5 S 4 W 29 14369 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL6-24-54 4301 332570 5 S 4 W 24 14299 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 1O-14-55 4301 332601 5 S 5 W 14 14331 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 11-5-54 4301 332664 5 S 4 W 5 14415 OilWell Shy_tlin

Shut-in

Shut-in

UTE TRIBAL16-24-55 t3Q-1W67?
4301332782

5 S
S

5 W 24 14384 Gas Well
MYRIN TR]BAL 14-19-55 5 5 W 19 15184 OilWell
MOON TRTBAL 13-27-54 4301 332801 5 S 4 W 27 15057 OilWell
MOON TRTBAL 11-27-54 4301 332845

43013!?!EE
4301332932

5 S
S

4 W 27 15135 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 15-15.55 E

5
5 W 15 15114 OilWell Shut-in

UTE TRIBAL 10.24-54 S 4 W 24 15364 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBALS-24-54 4301332933 5 S 4 W 24 15402 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 12.15-55 4301332981 5 S 5 W 15 1 5348 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL2-23-55 4301333045 5 S 5 W 23 1 5416 OilWell Shut-in
TAYLOR FEE 7.14-56 4301 333140 5 S 6 W 14 1 5601 OilWell Shut-in
wtLcox FEE 15-16-56 4301 3331 51 5 S 6 W 16 15527 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 11.13-55 4301333268 5 S 5 W 13 1 5692 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL7.14-55 4301333269 5 S 5

5
W 14 1 5693 OilWell Shut-in

FEDERAL 1O-3€5 4301333386 6 S w___
W

3 16297 OilWell Shut-in
BERRY TRIBAL.I 6-34D-54 4301333464 5 s*_,

S
4 34 16280 OilWell Shut-in

FEDERAL 1O-2€5 4301333542 6 5 W 2 16181 OilWell Shut-in
Shut-inUTE FEE 2-13.55 430',t333720 5 S

S-
5 W 't3 18659 OilWell

LC TRIBAL 13-16D-56 4301334282 5 6 W 16 17601 OilWell Shut-in
LC TRIBAL 4-27D-56 4301350262 5 S 6 W ?7*

16
17568 OilWell Shut-in

LC TRIBAL 8-16D-56 4301350599 5 S 6 W 18161 OilWell Shut-in
LC TRIBAL 15-8D-56 4301351060 5 S 6 W I 18862 OilWell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 6-9-54 4301351127 5 S 4 W I 19017 OilWell Shut-in
LC TRIBAL 16.30D-56 4301351132 5 S 6 W 30 18540 OilWell Shut-in
STATE TRIBAL 15-6-54 4301351227 5 S 4 W 6 18746 OilWell Shut-in

32 6t27t2017

rom: Linn Operating, LLC
fo: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
:Hective:May 1, 2017
WIRE FENCE CYN FED 15-1 4301330404 6 S 5 W 15 8233 Gas Well Shut-in
R FORK ANTELOPE CYN FED 25-1 4301330406 6 S 5 W 25 8234 Oil Well Shut-in
WOLF HOLLOW 22-1 4301330425 6 S 5 W 22 10370 Gas Well Shut-in
Z and T UTE TRIBAL 12-22 4301331311 5 S 4 W 22 11421 Oil Well Shut-in
UTETRIBA1.15-17 4301331649 5 S 4 VV 17 11956 OilVVell Shut-in
UTETRIBAL3-19 4301331830 5 S 4 VV 19 12197 OilVVell Shut-in
UTETRIBAL 14-17 4301332147 5 S 4 VV 17 12755 OilW/ell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 7-30 4301332167 5 S 4 W 30 12945 Oil Well Shut-in
UTETRIBAI.1-33 4301332185 5 :S 4 VV 33 13024 OilVVell Shut-in
UTElTilBAL5-24-55 4301332263 5 S 5 VV 24 13621 OilVVell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 10-16-55 4301332345 5 S 5 VV 16 13693 OilVVell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 15-30-54 4301332382 5 S 4 W 30 13944 Oil Well Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 14-21-54 4301332384 5 S 4 VV 21 13946 OilVVell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 13-30-54 4301332409 5 S 4 W 30 13968 Oil Well Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 3-33-54 4301332412 5 S 4 W 33 13938 Oil Well Shut-in
UTETRIBAL1-20-55 4301332414 5 S 5 VV 20 14548 Oil\¾ell Shut-in
LffE TTRIELAL9-29-54 4301332566 5 S 4 VV 29 14369 OilVVell :Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL6-24-54 4301332570 5 S 4 W 24 14299 Oil Well Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 10-14-55 4301332601 5 S 5 W 14 14331 Oil Well Shut-in
UTETTilBAL 11-5-54 4301332664 5 S ·4 VV 5 14415 OilVVell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 16-24-55 4301332672 5 S 5 W 24 14384 Gas Well Shut-in
MYRIN TRIBAL 14-19-55 4301332782 5 S 5 W 19 15184 Oil Well Shut-in
MOON TRIBAL 13-27-54 4301332801 5 S 4 W 27 15057 Oil Well Shut-in
MOON TRIBAL 11-27-54 4301332845 5 S 4 W 27 15135 Oil Well Shut-in
UTETRIBAL 15-15-55 4301332855 5 S 5 VV 15 15114 OilVVell Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 10-24-54 4301332932 5 S 4 W 24 15364 Oil Well Shut-in
UTE TRIBAL 8-24-54 4301332933 5 S 4 W 24 15402 Oil Well Shut-in
UTETRIBAL 12-15-55 4301332981 5 S 5 VV 15 15348 OilVVell Shut-ir
UTETRIBAL2-:23-55 4301333045 5 S 5 VV 23 15416 OilVVell Shut-ir
17tYLORFEE7-14-56 4301333140 5 S 6 VV 14 15601 OilVVell Shut-ir
WILCOX FEE 15-16-56 4301333151 5 S 6 W 16 15527 Oil Well Shut-in
LffE TIIIELAL11-13-55 4301333268 5 S 5 VV 13 15692 OilVVell Shut-in
UTE17tlELAL7-14-55 4301333269 5 S 5 VV 14 15693 OilVVell Shut-ir
FEDEFVrL10-3-65 4301333386 6 S 5 VV 3 16297 Oiltvell Shut-ir
BERRY TRIBAL.16-34D-54 4301333464 5 S 4 W 34 16280 Oil Well Shut-in
FEDERAL 10-2-65 4301333542 6 S 5 W 2 16181 Oil Well Shut-in
UTE FEE2-13-55 4301333720 5 S 5 VV 13 18659 OilVVell Shut-in
LC TRIBAL 13-16D-56 4301334282 5 S 6 W 16 17601 Oil Well Shut-in
LC TRIBAL4-27D-56 4301350262 5 S 6 W 27 17568 Oil Well Shut-in
LCTRIBAL8-16D-56 4301350599 5 S 6 VV 16; 18161 OilVVell Shut-ir
LCTTIIBJtL 15-8D-56 4301351060 5 S 6 VV 8 18862 OilVVell Shut-ir
UTETTRIELAL6-9-54 4301351127 5 S 4 VV 9 19017 OilVVell Shut-ir
LC TRIBAL 16-30D-56 4301351132 5 S 6 W 30 18540 Oil Well Shut-in
SÌÄTE TRIBAL 15-6-54 4301351227 5 S 4 W 6 18746 Oil Well Shut-in
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From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC

1

LC TRIBAL 1-29-56 4301351442 5 S 6 W 29
28

18876 OilWell Shut-in
CC Fee 7R-28-38 4301351852 3 S I W 18863 OilWell Shut-in
ABBOTT FEE 8-6D-54 4301351950 5 S 4 W 6 18964 OilWell Shuhin
Federal 1-9D-64
FEDERAL 14-9D-64

4301352020 6 S 4 W 9 19722 OilWell 9nqLrn
Shut-in4301352040 6 S 4 W 9 19690 OilWell

Ute Tribal 124D-54 430'.t352344 5 S 4 W 4 19352 OilWell Shut-in
State Tribal 10-6D-54 430135239s 5 S 4 W 6 '19425 OilWell Shut-in
State Tribal 14-6D-54 4301352455 5 S 4 W 6 19477 OilWell Shut-in
Federal 10-6D-65 4301352498 6 S 5 W 6 19612 OilWell Shut-in
Federal2-7D-65 4301352537 6 S 5 W 7 19630 OilWell Shut-in
Federal5-7D-65 4301352538 6 S 5 W 7 19613 OilWell Shut-in
Federal4-7D-65 4301352541 o S 5 W 7 19614 OilWell Shut-in
Federal3-7-65 4301 352560 E, S 5 W 7 19609 OilWell Shut-in
Federal 1-7D-65 4301 352589 o S 5 W 6 19615 OilWell Shut-in

33 6t27t2017

From: Linn Operating, LLC
To: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC
¯ñective:May 1,2017
LC TRIBAL 1-29-56 4301351442 5 S 6 W 29 18876 Oil Well Shut-in
CC Fee 7R-28-38 4301351852 3 S 8 W 28 18863 Oil Well Shut-in
ABBCYFTFEE8-6D-54 4301351950 5 S 4 VV 6 18964 OilVVell Shut-in
Federal 1-9D-64 4301352020 6 S 4 W 9 19722 Oil Well Shut-in
FEDEFLAL14-9D-64 4301352040 6 S 4 VV 9 19690 OilVVell Shut-in
Ute Tribal 12-4D-54 4301352344 5 S 4 W 4 19352 Oil Well Shut-in
State Tribal 10-6D-54 4301352395 5 S 4 W 6 19425 Oil Well Shut-in
SitateTribal14-6D-54 4301352455 5 S 4 VV 6 19477 OilVVell Shut-in
Federal10-6D-65 4301352498 6 S 5 VV 6 19612 OilVVell Shut-in
Fedenal2-7D-65 4301352537 6 S 5 VV 7 19630 OilVVell Shut-in
Federal5-7D-65 4301352538 6 S 5 VV 7 19613 OilVVell Shut-in
Federal 4-7D-65 4301352541 6 S 5 W 7 19614 Oil Well Shut-in
Federal3-7-65 4301352560 6 S 5 VV 7 19609 Oil\Nell Shut-in
Fedenal1-7D-65 4301352589 6 S 5 VV 6 19615 OilVVell Shut-in
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UPDATE ON SI WETLS FOR NAME CHANGE

Future Berrv Petroleum Wells

Scofield Thorpe 224LX Rig Skid:
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1,sr,20L7.

Scofield Thorpe 35-13
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May lst,2OL7.

Scofield Thorpe 23-31
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May Lst,20L7.

Wilcox Fee 15-16-55
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May Lsr,20L7.

LC Fee 8-15D-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May L't,20t7.

CC Fee 7R-28-38
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May Lst,20L7.

Taylor Fee 7-14-55
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May Lst,2017.

SFW Fee 13-10D-54
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May Lst,2017 .

LINN Enersv Wells

Mark2-25M
Received approved LINN Energy budget this month. Repair work under review.

Mitchell24Bt
Received approved LINN Energy budget this month. Repair work under review.

Galfoway *2-L482
Reclaim existing pit in Q2 2017. Project delayed due to wjnter weather.

Hamblin 2-26-A2
Received approved LINN Energy budget this month. Repair work under review.

4lroluUPDATEON SI WELLSFOR NAMECHANGE 4/10/17

Future Berry Petroleum Wells

Scofield Thorpe 22-41X Rig Skid:
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 16*,2017.

Scofield Thorpe 35-13
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 16*,2017.

Scofield Thorpe 23-31
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 16*,2017.

Wilcox Fee 15-16-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 16*,2017.

LCFee 8-15D-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 16', 2017.

CCFee 7R-28-38
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 16*,2017.

Taylor Fee 7-14-56
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 1'*, 2017.

SFW Fee 13-10D-54
Future Berry Petroleum well as of May 16*,2017.

LINNEnergy Wells

Mark 2-25A2
Received approved LINNEnergy budget this month. Repair work under review.

Mitchell 2-4B1
Received approved LINNEnergy budget this month. Repair work under review.

Galloway #2-14B2
Reclaim existing pit in Q2 2017. Project delayed due to winter weather.

Hamblin 2-26-A2
Received approved LINNEnergy budget this month. Repair work under



'TATE 
OF UTAH SHUT tN L[ST ESTTMATED p/A COSTS 4lrol2ot7

WELLNAME

Scofield Thorpe 22-47X Rig Skid

Scofield Thorpe 35-13

Scofield Thorpe 23-31

SFW Fee 13-10D-54

Wilcox Fee 15-16-55

ZtC Fee 8-15D-56

rCC Fee 7R-28-38

Fee 7-14-56

Mark2-25A2
Mitchell2-481
Galloway 2-L4B,2

Hamblin 2-26A2

FUTURE OPERATOR

Berry Petroleum Company

Berry Petroleum Company

Berry Petroleum Company

Berry Petroleum Company

Berry Petroleum Company

Berry Petroleum Company

Berry Petroleum Company
Petroleum

Berry Petroleum Company TOTAT

LINN Operating
LINN Operating
LINN Operating
LINN

LINN Operating TOTAI

ESTIMATED P/A COSTS

45,000

45,000

45,000

35,000

35,000

35,000

75,000

35,000

3so,(xro

75,000

75,000

30,000

75

255,000

S

s
s
s

S

s
s
s

s
s

s
s

LINN
STATE OF UTAH SHUT IN LISTESTIMATED P/A COSTS 4/10/2017

Energy
WELLNAME FUTUREOPERATOR ESTIMATEDP/A COSTS
Scofield Thorpe 22-41X Rig Skid Berry Petroleum Company $ 45,000
Scofield Thorpe 35-13 Berry Petroleum Company $ 45,000
Scofield Thorpe 23-31 Berry Petroleum Company $ 45,000
SFW Fee 13-10D-54 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000
Wilcox Fee 15-16-56 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000

¿LC Fee 8-15D-56 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000
/CC Fee 7R-28-38 Berry Petroleum Company $ 75,000
y Taylor Fee 7-14-56 Berry Petroleum Company $ 35,000

Berry Petroleum Company TOTAL $ 350,000

Mark 2-25A2 LINNOperating $ 75,000
Mitchell 2-4B1 LINNOperating $ 75,000
Galloway 2-14B2 LINNOperating $ 30,000
Hamblin 2-26A2 LINNOperating $ 75,000

LINN Operating TOTAL $



Shte cf Utah Mail - Unn Name Change and Berry Operator Change

Rachel Medi na <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Linn Name Change and Berry Operator Change
2 messages

Rachel Medina <r:achelmedina@utah.gov> Thu, Apr 20,2O1l at 11:5g AM
To: Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>, Randy Thackeray <randythackeray@utah.gov>

Dustin,

!.n! i. planning on moving all the wells from Linn lnc. to Linn LLC, then complete an operator change for the Berry wells.
Eight of the wells on the non+ompliance list will be move to Berry. Are you okay with us moving atftne wells to Berry,
putting the eight wells on the blanket bond, then getting the shut in plans and full cost bond when the move to Berryis
complete?

The blanket bond and ful! cost bonding for the Linn wells will of course be in place before we complete the move.

Attached is the plugging estimates for all twelve wells, as well as a list of which wells are going to the new Linn and
Berry. They have some details on what they plan to do with the wells on the Update list. Will tfris ne acceptable for a
shut in plan and plugging estimates?

Rachel Medina
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Bonding Technician
801-53&5260

tr ;3lr*ro11o137.pdf

Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>
Cc : Randy Thackeray <randythackeray@utah. gov>

I'm o.k. with those amounts. They should send in their plans for the wells.
IQuoted text hiddenl

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 8/116
801.538.5281 (ofc)
801.359.3940 (fax)

web: www.ogm.utah.gov

Thu, Apr 27,2017 at 10:40 AM

htps://mail.google.con/mail/ca/dlfrui=2&k=72fde6c6adllvi61v=fi&search=inbox&th= 15bh04906b345094&siml=15b8c83b8833fc83&siml= 1SbrO49O6lB4SO94

4/27/2017 Stateof Utah Mail - LinnName Change and Berry Operator Change

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>UTAH

Linn Name Change and Berry Operator Change
2 messages

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov> Thu, Apr 20, 2017 at 11:58 AM
To: Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>, Randy Thackeray <randythackeray@utah.gov>

Dustin,

Linn is planning on movingall the wells from Linn Inc. to Linn LLC, then complete an operator change for the Berry wells.
Eight of the wells on the non-compliance list will be move to Berry. Are you okay withus moving all the wells to Berry,
putting the eight wells on the blanket bond, then getting the shut in plans and full cost bond when the move to Berry is
complete?

The blanket bond and full cost bonding for the Linn wells willof course be in place before we complete the move.

Attached is the plugging estimates for all twelvewells, as well as a list of which wells are going to the new Linn and
Berry. They have some details on what theyplan to do withthe wells on the Update list. Will this be acceptable for a
shut in plan and plugging estimates?

Rachel Medina
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Bonding Technician
801-538-5260

20170420110137.pdf
58K

Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov> Thu, Apr 27, 2017 at 10:40 AM
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Cc: Randy Thackeray <randythackeray@utah.gov>

I'm o.k. with those amounts. They should send in theirplans for the wells.
[Quoted text hidden]

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
801.538.5281 (ofc)
801.359.3940 (fax)

web: www.ogm.utah.gov

https://mail.google.com/maillcalu/1/?ui=2&ik=72fde6d6ad&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15bb04906b345094&siml=15b8c63b8833fc83&siml=15bb04906b345094
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lune 14,2017

Mr. Dustin Doucet
State of Utah- DNR
Division of Oil, Cas and Mining
1594 West North Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 841l6

Re: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned requirements for eight (8) Fee Leases

Dear Mr. Doucet:

Beny Petroleum Company, LLC., and Linn Operating, LLC. emerged from bankruptcy as two standalone companies on
May l, 2017. Due to this recent action, Berry Petroleum Company, LLC. is curently evaluating the potential for eight
(8) wells, and respectfully submits the following plans to bring these wells into compliance as follows:

Sco{ield Thoroe 22-4lX Ris Skid
API # 43-007-30890
Berry Petroleum Company, LLC is curently evaluating the entire Scofield acreage block for potential and would like to
respectfully request a 90-day shut- in extension to September 15,2017 . After the well review is complete, Berry
Petroleum Company, LLC. will follow up with I of the 2 following procedures prior to August 15,2017: (l) File for
approval to PA well with a completion date prior to October 1,2017, or (2) Berry will commit to retum the well to
production prior to June I , 2018. The roads to this well are not open in the winter, so this well is not operated during
winter months.

Scofield Thoroe 35-ll
API # 43-007-309?r
Berry Petroleum Company, LLC is currently evaluating the entire Scofield acreage block for potential and would like to
respectfully request a 90-day shut- in extension to September 15,2017. After the well review is complete, Berry
Peholeum Company, LLC. will follow up with I of the 2 following procedures prior to August 15,2017: (1) File for
approval to PA well with a completion date prior to October 1,2017, or (2) Berry will commit to return the well to
production priorto June 1,2018. 'Ihe roads to this well are not open in the winter, so this well is not operated during
winter months.

Scofield Thorpe 23-31
APt # 43-007-31001
Berry Petroleum Company, LLC is currently evaluating the entire Scofield acreage block for potential and would like to
respectfully request a 90-day shut- in extension to September 15,2017. After the well review is complete, Berry
Petroleum Company, LLC. will follow up with I of the 2 following procedures prior to August 15,2Ol7: (l) File for
approval to PA well with a completion date prior to October 1,2017, or (2) Berry will commit to return the well to
production prior to June l, 2018. The roads to this well are not open in the winter, so this well is not operated during
winter months.

SWF Fee l3-l0D-54
API# 43-013-50892
Berry Petroleum Company, LLC proposes to Plug and Abandon in Q3 of 2017. We will be submitting
sundry/procedures for approval prior to September 15,2017. Due to this, Berry Petroteum Company, LLC respectfully
requests a 90-day shut-in extension to September 15,2017 .

Wilcox Fee 15-16-56
API # 43:013-50597

Roosevelt Office: 4000 South 4028 West, Roosevelt, UT 84066 . Ph: (a35) 722-1325. Fax: (435) 722-'1321

Corporate Office: 5201 Truxtun Ave., Bakersfield, CA 93309 . Ph:661-616-3900 unrrrw.berrypelroleum.com

Berry
Petroleum
CompanyLLC

June 14, 2017

Mr. Dustin Doucet
State of Utah - DNR
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 WestNorth Temple
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116

Re: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned requirements for eight (8) Fee Leases

Dear Mr. Doucet:

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC., and Linn Operating, LLC. emerged from bankruptcy as two standalone companies on
May 1, 2017. Due to this recent action, Berry Petroleum Company, LLC. is currently evaluating the potential for eight
(8) wells, and respectfully submits the following plans to bring these wells into compliance as follows:

Scofield Thorpe 22-41X Rig Skid
API # 43-007-30890
Berry Petroleum Company,LLC is currently evaluating the entire Scofield acreage block for potentialand would liketo
respectfully request a 90-day shut- in extension to September 15, 2017. After the well review is complete, Berry
Petroleum Company, LLC. will follow up with l of the 2 followingprocedures prior to August 15, 2017: (l) File for
approval to PA well with a completion date prior to October 1, 2017, or (2) Berry will commit to return the well to
productionprior to June 1, 2018. The roads to this well are not open in the winter, so this well is not operated during
winter months.

Scofield Thorpe 35-13
API # 43-007-30991
Berry PetroleumCompany, LLC is currently evaluating the entire Scofield acreage block for potentialand would like to
respectfully request a 90-day shut- in extension to September 15, 2017. After the well review is complete, Berry
Petroleum Company, LLC. will followup with I of the 2 followingprocedures prior to August 15, 2017: (1) File for
approval to PA well with a completion date prior to October 1, 2017, or (2) Berry will commit to return the well to
production prior to June l, 2018. The roads to this well are not open in the winter, so this well is not operated during
winter months.

Scofield Thorpe 23-31
API # 43-007-31001
Berry Petroleum Company,LLC is currently evaluating the entire Scofield acreage block for potential and would like to
respectfully request a 90-dayshut- in extension to September 15, 2017. After the well review is complete, Berry
Petroleum Company, LLC. will followup with 1 of the 2 followingprocedures prior to August 15, 2017: (1) File for
approval to PA well with a completion date prior to October 1, 2017, or (2) Berry will commit to return the well to
production prior to June 1, 2018. The roads to this well are not open in the winter, so this well is not operated during
winter months.

SWF Fee 13-10D-54
API# 43-013-50892
Berry Petroleum Company, LLC proposes to Plug and Abandon in Q3of2017. We will be submitting
sundry/procedures for approval prior to September 15, 2017. Due to this, Berry Petroleum Company, LLC respectfully
requests a 90-day shut-in extension to September 15, 2017.

Wilcox Fee 15-16-56
API # 43-013-50597

Roosevelt Office: 4000 South 4028 West, Roosevelt, UT 84066 Ph: (435) 722-1325 · Fax: (435) 722-1321
Corporate Office: 5201 Truxtun Ave., Bakersfield, CA 93309 · Ph: 661-616-3900
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Berry Petroleum Company, LLC proposes to retum this well to production prior to Septernber I ,2017 , following the end
of raptor stipulations in August 2017. Berry respectfully requests a shut-in extension to September I ,2017.

LC Fee 8-l5D-56
API # 43-013-50597
Berry Peffoleum Company, LLC proposes to complete this well in Q3 of20t7, following raptor stipulations in August
2017. Berry respectfully requ€sts a shut-in extension to September 30,2017.

CC Fee 7R-28-38
API# 43-013-51852
Plan to return to production in Q4 of 2017. Linn had submitted for a preconstruction permit with UDAQ to operate well
below flaring limits, and we are currently transfening this documentation to Berry Petroleum Company, LLC. Due to
this, Berry respectfully requests a 6-month Temporary Abandonment extension thru December 31,201'l .

TaYlor Fee 7-14-56
APr# 43-013-33140
Berry Petroleum Company, LLC proposes to retum this well to production prior to July 15, 201"1 , and respectfully
requests a shut-in extension to July 15,2017.

Regulatory Specrb/isf 2
4028 W. 4000 S
Roosevelt, U'f 84066
T: 435 722 0065
c 435.823.1846
anq@brv.com

Roosevelt Office:4000 South 4028 Wesl, Roosevelt, UT 84066 ' Ph: (435) 722-1325. Fax: (435) 722-1321

Corporate Office: 5201 Truxtun Ave., Bakersfield, CA 93309 ' Ph: 661-616-3900 www,berrypetroleum.com

Berry
Petroleum
CompanyLLC

Berry Petroleum Company, LLC proposes to return this well to production prior to September 1, 2017, following the end
of raptor stipulations in August 2017. Berry respectfully requests a shut-in extension to September l ,2017.

LC Fee 8-15D-56
API # 43-013-50597
Berry Petroleum Company, LLC proposes to complete this well in Q3of2017, following raptor stipulations in August
2017. Berry respectfully requests a shut-in extension to September 30, 2017.

CC Fee 7R-28-38
API# 43-013-51852
Plan to return to productionin Q4of2017. Linn had submitted for a preconstruction permit with UDAQto operate well
below flaring limits, and we are currently transferringthis documentation to Berry Petroleum Company, LLC. Due to
this, Berry respectfully requests a 6-month Temporary Abandonment extension thru December 31, 2017.

Taylor Fee 7-14-56
API# 43-013-33140
Berry Petroleum Company,LLCproposes to return this well to production prior to July 15, 2017, and respectfully
requests a shut-in extensionto July 15, 2017.

S ly,

AVVLrry drea Gurr
Petroleum Regulatory Specialist 2
Companya 4028 W. 4000 S

Roosevelt, UT 84066
T: 435.722.0065
C. 435.823.1846
anq@bry.com

Roosevelt Office: 4000 South 4028 West, Roosevelt, UT 84066 · Ph: (435) 722-1325 · Fax: (435) 722-1321
Corporate Office: 5201 Truxtun Ave., Bakersfield, CA 93309 · Ph: 661-616-3900
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Schematic - Current

SCOFIELD THORPE 2241X RIG SKID
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Sufrce Cr:iagCrurat I 5.0-1,14.1.0;
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Schematic - Current

Well Name: SCOFIELDTHORPE2241X RIG SKID

-RE- BB-IWW--
Most Recent Job
a categay prenay my yse sEcoximy MT ype strt Dale EndDan
Wortçover/Mpirt Tutpnq Repair IRepipce 9/11/2007 S/13/2007
TD: 6,247.0 Vertical - OriginalHole, 5 3 20E 10:09 24 AM

ZoneMD (ftKB) Zones Depth Vertical schematie (actual)

4.9 PolishedRod; l.500; 30.00
Tubing;2.875; 6.50; 35.0

15.1 PonyRod 2-8 2;0.8"5;18.00-
. ConductorCement;15.0-83.0;35.1 9723/2002

53.1 , 20.000; 0.00; 83.0
SurfaceCasinsCement: 15.0-1.144.0

83.0 10/20/2002
1,128.0 SuckarRod;0.875;1.825.00

13.375;48.00; H-40; 1.128.0
1.144.0 Intermediatei CasingCement; 15.0-
1.878.0 2,882.0; 10/182002

SuckerRod:0.'50: "50.00
2,628.0 Tubing;2.875; 6.50;5.596.0
2.857.0 9.625;36.00;1-55;2.857.0

Intermediate2 CasingCement; 15.0-
2.881.9 6,013.0; I1/20 2002

5.497.0 SuckerRod; 0."$0; 2,869.00
SinkerBar W STAB;1.500; 115.005,596.1
ANCHOR;2.875; 5.598.4

5.598.4

5.599.4
Seatingnipple; 2.8 '5; 5,599.5

5.611.9 Rod Pump;1.500:6.00
Tubing;2.8"5; 6.50;5.631.15,618.1

5,631.2 2 ??SX2 3/8 CHANGEOVER2.875:
5 631.95,631.9

5."16 9 Tubing;2.375; 4.'0; 5.989.5
LinarCament; 5.71".0-6,247.0;

5.989.5 1124/2002

5,989 8 Collar;2.375; 5.990.0

Acidizing; 5.995.0-6,004.0; 8 17.2003

6,00'9 7.000;23.00;J-55;6,008.0

6.013.1
PSTD; 8/2T200'; 6.020.06.020.0 PLUG;6.020.0; 8 27/2007 BridgePlug - Permanent;6,020.0;

6.023.0 8 27 2007

6.031.9 PLUG;6.072.0;9 1 2003 BridgePlug - Parmanent;6,072.0;
6.0"5 1 9 l 2003

6.154.9 ). y LinarCement(plug);6,155.0-6,247.0;
y á 1124 2002

6.24il
.500; 11.60;I-55; 6.245.0

1
6.24' O

www.peloton,t om Page 1/1 Report Printed:
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Schematic - Current

We11Name: SCOFtELD-THORPE 35-13
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acategay pmmynywa secawymType set oss ed aale
WorkoveriMaint Svygbbinq Swabbinq 1118/2010 11/10/2010
TD: 7,045.0 Vertical - OriginalHola, 5:3:201" 10:14:14AM

MD (ftKB) Zones Vertical schematic (actual)
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13.5
Polished Rod;L500 26.00

14.1 Conductor Coment; 14.0-9ÃÂ
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16.000; 0.û0;94.0
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2.629.9 MAHOGANY 1630 0 SuckerRod; 0.8"$; 6.289.00
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Production CasingCement;4,880.0-
6,006.9 WASATCH 6,00 7,045.0;8312005
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6.3"L1
PSTD: 7/16 200": 6.450.0

6.450.1 CIBP;6.450.0; 11/172005 BridgePlug - Permanent;6.450.0;
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SCOFIELDJHORPE 23.31

Itort Rccent Job
ilcaqo, lHrry.ErlFilnmnlCin llnilirlComnlalon

wrJoT)ra il$taE
t r6rrfv)6

,BS8E
lr)6rrn(l6

tD; 7,ZXl.0 OrigiDd Hol€, 513,.:017 10:l"l:56 AII

[{D(ftIG) Zoa*s
Zonr
Dapth

l:erticsl :ch*metic (crtual)

4

t.t

:6

9{

I,0-19

t,050

t,0'8

t.-i60

r,,l]:

t,496

t,6 13

1,931

4.r31

6,tl5

6,5'r 6.{ i;
I:TB

Polirh:d Rod Sink:r Brr: 1.250: 22.00-

Conductor Crora! lf -0.94.0; 9r4.t00J
16.000; 0.00;9{.0
Surfrce Crriug&meag 14.0-1,050.0;
9j25r100,
Tubing 2.375;6,3:4.0
SuckerRod; 0.8?5; 6,309.00

9.62J; 36.00; I-55; 1,039.0

?.000; 13.00; I-5J; 6,166.0
PBTD: 10128,200J; 1,360,0
C+meal Plue: l,l 60"0-1.421.0;
10,?5/l005

Ceo+nlPlug 1,.t96.0.1,6 I $,0;
l0't4c005

www.P€loton,com Page trt Rcport Prlntedt 6lu20al

Schematic - Current

Well Name: SCOFIELD-THORPE23-31

Most Recent Job
JibCakg&y PIBairy mTy! SeembrymTge Sta10ale En10ata
Comp etion initial Completon 1/5/2006 3/25/2006

TD: 7,200.0 OriginalHola. 5/320 C 10:14:56 MI

MD (ftKB) 2'ones L° Vertical schematic (actual)

4

14 Foushed RodSinker Bar; L150; 22.00"

26
ConductorCement;14.0-94.0;9/4/2005
16.000; 0.00; 94.0
SurfacaCasingCement;14.0-1.050.0;

94 9725/2005
Tubing;2.375; 6,3"4.0
SuckerRod;0.875; 6.309.00

1,039 9.625;36.00;J-55; 1,039.0

1,050

l.0"S
7.000;23.00;1-55;6.166.0
PBTD;10 28 2005; 1.360.0

L360 CamantPlug. 1.360.0-1.422.0;
10 25 2005

P g; I,496.0-1,618.0;

1.931

4 31

6.335

www.peloton.com Page 1/1 Report Printed:



n
Well Name:

Schematic - Current

wLcox FEE t5-1556

Uort Reent Job
roGn9d,
W6rkaudlff

ilrirr*.rlF lslrlJoTlpfuHno lReorlr/Flcnlar:e
iyl Delr
t1/3t2m7

,xto*
llt6,rroft7

ww/v.pcloton.com Pago 1,1 Report Prtntsd: 513/2017

V.rricd - Oridpd Holc. 5r-1;!01? 10:15:44 AIr'I

lishcd Rod; l-500; ll-00
Rod;0.8i5;

Coaductor Cruat l{.0-S0.0;
?i24r2006

I4.000; 82.50; 80.0
Surfrc* CsilgGamq 1.t.0-,112.0;
8,,20r006

6!5;24.00; I-55;359.0

Suck*rRod; 0.915; l.SlJ.00

Rod;0.i50; S00.00

Tubing; 2.871; 6.J0; {,654.8

Productior &siag Cement; ?90.0-
.1,995.0; 8,,1613006

Sard Frec; 3,128.0--1,]d4.0; 9 r14./

Greea River (frnrl) SuckrRod; 0.:J0: 1,990.50.

Sand Frac; 3,9{-1.0-3,990.0; 9il{it006;
scrern oui on.ll

Srad Frec; 4,3i0.0--1.{0,1.0; 9, l3 Iscre:n oul on 6:a I
SrndFrac;.1,49-r-0{.536.0;9,10'2006; I
r'.'ellscrernedouil6ll-rlasdpumped I Sucker Rod; 0.750: lll.00

Aachoricetcher: 1.3: 5 : {,6 5 l. 5

Tubing 2.8 15; 6.50; {.867.5
Sinlsrr Brr; 1.500; I 1J.00

Rod Pump;1.500; 15.S0

Sgnd Prec: 4.660.0{.3i 0.0 : 9rl 0,2006

Puup S*etirgNippb; I.815; d,868.6
Tubing: !.8?5 : 6.-s0; {-901.1
Notchsd collcr: i.Sa5: .1,9[t 1.5

PBTD; ll,5il00':.1,926.0

Productiou Cesirog Caoeut (plug):
{,9}5.0-4,995.0; S 16 2C'S6

5.i00: I 5.50: I-J5: ^1,950,0

t6i n

l_-i{9

I t-'

-1,,iJ

1 996

{.: s-i

{-6-:{_

-l.E :.r

G,N

I&hogro.y

TS&i

Doughs Cr*ak

Bhet Shrk
Crsde Pdr

'L'trlrnd Buttr

\\'.rsrltb

3.9

l.r. I

29.9

357.9

+t 1.9

961 .9

l,i i5. r

:,5 ll. l

-1,:00.1

l,3r{.:

t,9{:-9

_1,996. i

.t,3Ji.!

{..t0_1.9

d.5 16. I

{.6J,r.9

4,660. I

.1,$-1-r.6

{.s 5 t.0

{.36.'.5

{,9 01.:

t,9:5.9

4,9 -1i. i

t,9s0.0

Schematic - Current

Well Name: WILCOX FEE 15-16-56

Most Recent Job
MC3Iigory AdurymTypE Seco yMType StW10am ENDan
Workover/Maint Tubinq Seppir/Replace 11/3/2007 11/5/20D7

TD: 4,995.0 Vertical - OriginalHole, 5 01" 10:15:44 AM

MD (ftKB) Zones Vertical schematic (actual)

3.9
Polished Rod; 1.500; 12.00

14.1 y my . Pony Rod;0.875; 4.
ConductorCement;14.0-80.0;
7/24/2006

29.9 14.000; 82.50; 30.0
Surface CasingCement; 14.0-422.0;

357.9 8/20/2006

3.625;24.00; 1-55;359.0
421.9

SuckerRod;0.37$;1.525.00
961.9 GR 962 0

Mahogany L549 0
1,555.1 SuckerRod;0.750; 800.00

Tubing;2.875; 6.50;4,654.8
2,577.1 TGR3 2.5" 9 Production CasingCement; 790.0-

4.995.0;3:26 2006
3.200.1

3.344.2
SandFrac;3,328.0-3.344.0;9/14/2006

SuckerRod¡0 "$0;1.990.50Douglas Creek 3.354 0 -GreenRiver(finsi) ----

3,942.9 Sand Frae;3,943.0-3.980 0; 9 14 20046,

3,996.1 Blek Shale 3.996 3
Castle Peak C53 3

4,345.5

SandFrac;4,3"0.0-4,404.0;9 13 2006;
4.403.9 screen out on 6e - -

SandFrac;4,493.0-4.536.0;9 10 2006;
4.536.1 v;allscreened out; 62132= sd pumped SuckerRod;0."$0; 3'5.00

taland Butta 4.65 s,(

4.654.9 1.x
Anchor/catcher;2.STS;4,657.5

4.660.1
Tubing;2.8'5; 6.50;4.867.5

SandFrac;4,660.0-4,850.0;9:10/2006 SinkerBar;1.500;115.00
4,835.6

Rod Pump;1.500; 15.50

4.351 0

4.86
. Pump SeatingNipple;2.8"5; 4.868.6

Tubing;2.ST5; 6.50;4.901.1
4.9012 Notchedcollar;2.S"5;4,901.5

4.925 9 PBTD; 11/5200¯; 4.926.0

Production CasingCement (plug);4.935.0 4.935.0-4.995.0; S 26 2006

4.930.3
.

5.500; 15.50;I-55; 4.950.0

www.peloton.com Page 1/1 Report Printed:



I
l/Yell Name:

Schematic -Cunent

LC FEE 0.15D$6

tlort Rccent Job
6rurr
:6inrldall

rilrrJollF itErrlJollr,.inlli.lcamBtrftn l^FF
Irrl Drlr
tf)lDttlE

rdD*
lD7DO16

www.pcl,oton,com Pago trl RrponPdntedr 6til201l

Directioad - OrigindHole, 5r],20II l0:l6:t7 Alt

0.0

t9.0

.t8 t.0

615.S

616.8

6J9.t

650.1

9?.t.1

1,60:.9

1,860.6

1,8r9.9

l,:59.S

t,350.t

:,860.6

3,61:.9

,r,:9s-9

{,588.9

{,9,1:.9

J.l ?.1.9

.{,519.?

5,520.0

5,5t0,3

5.561.'

5,561-0

6, t: t.s

6,1'.t.?

6,255.9

Surfrcr CrriagCemcaq 19.0-660.0; li5,'1015

i;14.00; I-55;660.0

Production Cesbg Cenrut 19.0-6,156.0; l; l-1,l0l5

Cer ir g Ceo'rr (plu g) ; 5,520.0 -6,25 6.0: I l,l,l0 I 5

Schematic - Current

Well Name: LCFEE 8-15DJi6

Most Recent Job
& CMig&y mry MThit Sicamisy a Tga StartDas EmlDm
Comptelian initial Compleion AFE 1/23/2015 1/27/2015

D. 6¾6.0 Directional - OriginalHola, 5 3 20l~ 10:16:27AM

MD (ftKB) Zones Vertical schematic (actual)

0.0

19.0

48 1.0
Surface CasingCement;19.0-660.0; 1/5/2015

615.8

616.8

659.1

660.1 8.625;24.00; I-55; 660.0

9'4.1

1.607.9

1,860.6

1.8'9.9 |

2,759.8

2.850.1

2.860.6
ProductionCasingCement 19.0-6,256.0; 1:14.2015

4.588.9

4.945.9

5.l"4.9

5.518.

5.520.0 ----Production Casins Coment(plug); 5,520.0-6.256.0: 1 14 2015

5.520.3

5.564ß 5.500;17.00;N-80;5.564.0

6.125.0

6.l"4.9

6,255.9

www.pelotona om Page 1/1 Report Printed:



I
Well llame:

Schematlc - Cunent

cc FEE 7R-28-38

lilort Rccent Job
b!cr{u,
/[i6rlou.r/llff

nEI.EltF
l'lifi.irll ii

rsrn lJoTl?r
lmdrlFhalrca Flrrl

il*ror!
uLDOli

m Diti
v5r20t4

I U: r't,JUZ.U t'irlicd - OrigndHole, 5r3r2017 l0:l?n6 AII

h{D (ftKB) Zotac
Zone
Dap$ \'erticrl scheustic (actorl)

2i.l

.t8,1-9

1,5.r0.0

2,66,t.0

3,961.9

.r,868.1

7,.ti^t"l

8,65'r.2

9,096.0

9,its.9

9,681"t

9.:{:.3

9,918.9

9,905.S

10,0:9.9

10,19i.9

t0.5ls.i

10,5s3.9

I 0,61:. I

10,6r9.1

10,63 l. l

10,;9{.0

I0.90'.1

10,9{t.9

t0,916.0

It,oci 9

i I,010.0

I 1,05 l.S

t l,08c.t

t I .l l0_1

TOC

Gt {Iowh"..
I{rho;ay

ffi**t
myt&
th*h
c&1

CR4

CTT4A

cL(

CR6

CR''A
flrtrtrrT

lior$ Horu

3.3*$ {

+-14*.{
{.868.i

ffil{+T,*ffi,eo65oo;

ffiIffiI ""

-;r!{
l,lii
lili;
9,000

9.3{tl

9,6n-

9.-rl

9,t$6

{

l0.i

ti:

SendFrrs; 8,800.0-9,0$6.Q 6.13n0 E

Sand frrc; 9,I36.0-9,{16.0; 6/3l2013

Srnd Frec; 9,5!0.0-9.153.0; 6i3,r:0 l3

Srnd Ftec; 9,902.0-10.1{6.0; 5,?,'1013

Srod Frac; 10,:06.0-10.1:1.0; 5r.1,,1013

Saad Frsc: I 0.i 6{.0-t 0, 10:.0;
{ rl6r20l3

Ssad Frec: I0.-9"t.0-l 1,080.0;
4 rl1,201-l

SucLerRod; 0.150; 3,37!.60
Producliou Cesirg &EcaX .1,800.0.
I 0,020.0; 1il2i20 l3
Camrlt fuuarze; 8,800-0-9,4 I 6.0;
9.'l900lt
Sidrg Bg; 1.500; !37.40
Rod InsertPuap: l -?50: 18.00
AncLol'crtchrr; 2.3: 5 ; 9,6{8. 5
Tubing; 2.875; 6-!0; 9,681.0
hmp Ssetine Nippk: 2.8?5; 9,681.1
P*rf sub: 2.8?5: 9,6$6. I
Tuling; I.875: 6-!0; 9,71 8.4

1.000; 16^00; P-l l0; 9,9{.1.0
Ccurat fuu*ze: l0,l ?5.0-10,1 76.0:
4',29,A0ll
Crueat Squ:az*; t0,106.0-l 0..t::.0;
11,23 201-l
Liner Cement 9-738"0-l 1,3 Sl.0;
3,21.'2013

PBTD; 6t27'2011: Il,lI! 0

Lirer Crmmt fulug); I l,-r I 1.0-
I 1,38L0; 3'?l rl0l-1

5.000; 1S.00; P-l l0: I 1.-150.0

www.peloton,com Page lrt Report Printed! 61312017

Schematic - Current

Well Name: CC FEE 7R-28-38

WW-8.-- ---I--
Most Recent Job
M Caligay Onnmy Type Sacmbry MTyt Sm10ale EM Om
Workover/Main /WtificiplLitt Repair/ReplaceRod 3/4/2014 3/6/2014
TD: 11,382•l Vertical - OriginalHole, 5:3:2017 10:17 26 AM

ZoneMD (ftKB) Zones Dapth i estical schematie (actual)

PolishedRod;1.500;30.0
25.3 Pony Rod; 1.500; 20.00

24.000; 169.00;99.0
484.9 SurfaceCasingCamant; 19.0-650.0;

29:2013
1.540.0 16.000;65.00;H-40; 530.0

SuckerRod; 1.000;2,605.002,664.0 TOC 3.508 9 IntermediateCasingCem÷nt;19.0-
3,961.9 3,990.0;2/25/2013

GR (Fouck.. 4.140 0 *9.625; 36.00;I-55;3.962.0

4,868.1 Mahoµny 4.368 0 SuckerRod; 0.8'5;2.775.00
Tubing;2.8"S;6.50;9,6462

7,454.1 s Creek
. SuckerRod;0. 50;3.5"2.60

Production CasingCement;4,300.0-8,65°.2
ateh gi 10.020.0;3 12 2013

9,086.0
CR3 9A000 SandFrac;8.800.0-9.036.0;6 3/2013 nS useza;8.800.0-9,416.0;

CR4 9.3010 SandFrac;9,136.0-9.416.0;63/20l3 SinkarBar;1.500;53".40
9.543.9

.. . RodInsertPump; I '50;28.00
CR4A 9.6 ' SandFrac;9.520.0-9."$3.0; 6 3/2013 Anchoricatcher;2.S"5;9,648.5

9,681.1 Tubing;2.875; 6.50;9,681.0
Pump SeatingNipple;1.875; 9,682.19,742.8 CR' 9.7 3 Perf sub; 2.875; 9.6S6.1

9.318,9 Tubing;2.875; 6.50;9,718.4

9,905.8 CR6 9.9060
7.000;26.00;P-110;9,944.0
CementSqueeze;10.175.0-10,1"6.0;

10,029.9 SandFrac;9.902.0-10.146.0;5 7.201) 4/29/2013
/ Cement Squeeze; 10,206.0-10.472.0;

10,297.9 CR"A it- SandFrac; 10.206.0-10.4^2.0; 5 2 2013 12,13 2013
Flatstaff 13.5 LinerCement;9.'38.0-l l,381.0;

10.5"S.I 3212013

10.585.9

SandFrac;10.564.0-10,70".0:
10.642.1 4 16 2013

10,681.1

10,794.0

10.90".2

SandFrac: 10.~93.0-11,080.0
10.942.9 4 15 2013

10.9"6,0

11.005.9

11.020.0

11.051.8

11.030.1 PBTD;62'2013;Il2lf0
LinerCement (plug; 11.312.0-

11.310.4 Northhorn i 11.382.0;3212013
5.000;IS.00;P-Il0;ll.350.0

www.peloton.tom Page 1/1 Report Printed:



-Well Name:

Schematic - Current

TAYLOR FEE 7-1't-56

[ost Rcccnt Job
h!cfgal
Wartnvdll*rl

lrrryJ.rlF lffir.ETt!.
futino lRcoeirlReolacp

itflo;Iti!
v)2nfi7

,|0D.*
8nanm7

I U: 3,IrifU.U Yrrticrl - OriiiDd Hole, 5,13.,:017 l0:18:05 A}{

I\,lD (ftKB) Zonar
Zoae
Deflh \:rrlical s cheantic {acluel)

-0.J

l4.l

41.0

,r00-9

.r I 9-9

1.s90.9

1,590_9

3.0:1.5

3,100.1

3, ts:.r

3,S50. I

4,003.9

.t,:9{.0

1,49S.0

.t,5 -{. I

+.618.0

4.8:1 1.0

+,s11_9

*.8+9..t

+.s?9.6

4,9{t.9

4,959.0

.t.960.6

5_00-r.6

TGn_1

Grdao Gul€&

Do4:hs Cr*el;

Blx! $bdr
Carth Prah

-urtilrad Btttr

ltr:*ret*h

:.:9i

i0r,

-i.l:6;

{.0i{ ;
+.:ES ,:

r.6.t6

.r. $

Rod: l-U0:22.00

Conducior Cr:aaq 14.0-9{.0 ;
?L!5.,?006

14.000; 8?.50r 9{-0
Surfece Casiag Caurat 1,1.0 420.0;
E,f7..2006

8.625; 24.00; I-55;.102.0

$uckrrRod; 0.815: l-5i0.00
Sucl*r Rod: 0.1J0: 850.00

Tubinr !.875; 6.50; f-5?1.4
Suckrr Rod; 0.i5 0; l.<0.00

Proiluctioa Crsiag Gorat 560.0-
5,020.0; 3rl5r!006

Srnd Frec; -1,106.0.3,1E2.0; 8r29,'1005;
16,-i0 ottrsr sd

Sand Frac; 3.S50.0-J.999.0; Sit9,,2006;
l6 30 ottn*r rd

SuckrrRod: 0.150: I

Surd Frac; 4,19,1.0-1,49S.0; 8129,2006;
16.'30 otte*'r sd

Suck*r Rod; 0.:50; 3?3.0Ct

.{achor,tcetchar, f ,Sl5: 4,5

Sand Frae: "1,6dS.0-l.S{1.0: 9''19, 1006;
16'-10 ottewr sd

Tubing l.S1l: 6.50: 1-8{S.-t

Sldret Bu; l.-r00: 115.00

Prmp: 1.500; {.00

hrup Serting Nipple: 2.Si5: {,3.19.4

Tubiug; 2.8'5 : 6.5 0; {.8?9.5

Notchcd coller: 1.8:i:.1.8r9.9

PBTD: 6'26 100?: {,91{.0

Produciion Caslag Caaruf /glrrg);
{,959.0-5,010.0; S l5 10$6

!.500: 15.50; I.i!: 5,005.5

;:
t

www.peloton,com Poge lrl Report Printedr 6l3l20'il

Schematic - Current

Well Name: TAYLOR FEE 7-14-56

HE-WW- HE-IME--
Most Recent Job
acaleµy pensynTy seuruirymyype set oma emone
Workover/Maint Tubinq Reppir/Replace 6/22/2007 8/28/2007
TD: 5,020.0 Vertical - Orignal Hola. 5/3 2017 10:18.05 AM

MD (ftKB) 2 ones D Vertical schematic (actual)

-0.3

PolishedRod;1.250;22.00
14.1 .

. .

PONY,2', 6'.; 0.875; 8.00

I ConductorCement;14.0-94.0;
7/25/2006

41.0
3

14.000;82.50;94.0
Surface CasingCement;14.0-420.0;

403.9 877/2006

8.625;24.00; 1-55;402.0
419.9

SuckerRod; 0.8'5; 1.550.00
1.590.9 SuckerRod;0."$0; 850.00

Tubing;2.875; 6.50;4.571.4
SuckerRod;0."50; 150.002.590.9

TOR3 2,595 0 Production Casin:Cament; 660.0-
3.0'3.5 5.020.0; 8215 2006

3.100.1 Garden Gukh 3.100 a

SandFrac;3,l06.0-3.182.0; S 29 2006;
3.182.1 16 30 ottawa sa

Douglas Creek 5356 3 SuckerRod;0.750;I 50.00
3,850.1 Sand Frac; 3.850.0-3,999 0; 8 19/2006;

16 30 ottawa sd -

4,003.9 Black Shale 4.004 3
Castle Peak 4.255 0

4.294.0

SandFrac;4,294.0-4,493 0; 8 29 2006;
4.498.0 16 30 ottawa sa

SuckerRod;0.250; 375.00
Anchoricatcher;2.STí;4,574.1

4.5'4.1

Lt÷landButte 4.646 0
4.648.0

SandFrac;4,648.0-4,842.0;S292006; Tubing;2.S"$:6.50;4.848.3

4.831.0 16 30 ottawa sa SinkerBar; 1.500; 115.00
Pump; 1.500; 4 03

4.341.9

4.849.4 Pump Seating Nipple;2.875; 4,349.4
Tubing;2.8"5; 6.50:4.8"9.5Wasatch £8

4.3"9.6 Notched collar; 2.8'5;4.S'9.9

4.943.9 PBTD; 6 26 200'; 4,944.0

4.959.0 Production CasingCement (plug);
4.959.0-5.020.0; S 15 2006

4.960.6

5.005.6 5.500: 15.50:1-55:5,005.5

www.peloton.tom Page 1/1 Report Printed:



6121rN17 State cf Utah Mail - RE: Fdlor up to VM I left you re B€rry Petroleum Cornparry, LLC non cornpliant wdls

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

RE: Follow up to VM I left you re Berry Petroleum Company, LLC non compliant
wells
3 messages

Gurr, Andrea N. <ang@bry.com>
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>
Cc: "Hyder, John W." <jwh@bry.com>, "Rosenlieb, Trent R." <tn@bry.com>

Rachel,

Thu, Jun 15,2017 at 7:55 AM

Thank you for your suggestions yesterday- per your response below, Berry has chosen to submit a letter. Please
submit the attached letter & wellbore diagrams re the 8 nonrompliant wells for Dustin's review.

As I mentioned yesterday, Trent Rosenlieb @ Bakersfield office will be meeting with your team on Tuesday to discuss.

Thank you,

Andrea Gurr

Reg ulatory Speci ali st I I

4028W.4000 S.

Roosevelt, UT 84066

T 435.722.0065

c. 435.823.1846

From: Rachel Medina [mailto:rachelmedina@utah.gov]
Sent Wednesday, June 14, 2017 2:27 PM
To: Gun, Andrea N. <ang@bry.com>
Cc: Hyder, John W. <jwh@bry.com>; Rosenlieb, Trent R. <tn@bry.com>
Subject Re: Follow up to VM I left you re Berry Petroleum Company, LLC non compliant wells

HiAndrea,

Berry's inactive status is due to the face that they cunently have no open well-bores attached to the company. Once the
operator change is complete that status will move to active.

As for the 8 non-compliance wells, you can either do a sundry for each wells, or you can do a letter covering each well
individually. Dustin will want the plans to be detailed so please be sure to include as mush information as possible.

ht@://mail.google.conr/mail/ca/d1l?ui=2&ik=72fde6d6d&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15cc24fll0035adf&siml=15cac0986e6ba13&siml='l5r;ad142171de400&s...
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Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

RE: Follow up to VM I left you re Berry Petroleum Company, LLC non compliant
wells
3 messages

Gurr, Andrea N. <ang@bry.com> Thu, Jun 15, 2017 at 7:55 AM
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Cc: "Hyder, John W." <jwh@bry.com>, "Rosenlieb, Trent R." <trr@bry.com>

Rachel,

Thank you for your suggestions yesterday-- per your response below, Berry has chosen to submit a letter. Please
submit the attached letter & wellbore diagrams re the 8 non-compliant wells for Dustin's review.

As I mentioned yesterday, Trent Rosenlieb @Bakersfield office will be meeting with your team on Tuesday to discuss.

Thank you,

Andrea Gurr
leum

98tWu< Regulatory Specialist II

4028 W.4000 S.

Roosevelt, UT 84066

T:435.722.0065

C. 435.823.1846

From: Rachel Medina (mailto:rachelmedina@utah.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, June 14, 2017 2:27 PM
To: Gurr, Andrea N. <ang@bry.com>

Cc: Hyder, John W. <jwh@bry.com>; Rosenlieb, Trent R. <trr@bry.com>

Subject: Re: Follow up to VM I left you re Berry Petroleum Company, LLC non compliantwells

Hi Andrea,

Berry's inactive status is due to the face that they currently have no open well-bores attached to the company. Once the
operator change is complete that status will move to active.

As for the 8 non-compliance wells, you can either do a sundry for each wells, or you can do a letter covering each well
individually. Dustin willwant the plans to be detailed so please be sure to include as mush information as possible.

https://mail.google.com/maillcalu/1/?ui=2&ik=72fde6d6ad&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15cc24f340035adf&siml=15cac098f6e6ba13&siml=15cad142171de400&s...
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Either way (sundries or letter) you can email the plans to me for Dustin's review.

Thanks!

On Wed, Jun 14, 2017 at 10:25 AM, Gun, Andrea N. <ang@bry.com> wrote:

Rachel,

I left you a voicemail, but wanted to follow up with an email to a question I have. Cunently, Berry Petroleum
Company, LLC operator status is inactive & being held up by 8 non-compliant wells. When Berry applied for active
operator status it was believed to PA these wells, however, after a review has been conducted upper management
has suggested altemate options. I would like to submit the new proposals for review, so my question to you is,
should I prepare each proposal on a Form 9 (old school paper form), and send them to Dayne, Dustin, and yourself?
Or should I submit electronically, selecting one of the Berry Petroleum options as operator in the E-permitting
system?

Trent Rosenlieb will be traveling to Utah next week and plans to visit your office, so I would like to get these to your
team and in review for discussion when he is there. Let me know your thoughts, I am happy to submit as you think
willwork best.

Thank you,

Andi

Andrea Gurr

Regu I atory Speciali st ll

4028 W.4000 S.

Roosevelt, UT 84066

T:435.722.0065

c.435.823.1846

Rachel Medina

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining

Bonding Technician

https://mail.google.con/mdl/calullPui=2&ik=72fd"*"69r;sw=pt&search=inbox&th=15cc2484o035ad8siml=15cac0986e6ba13&siml=15cad14217'lceAOfdis... 23
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Either way (sundries or letter) you can email the plans to me for Dustin's review.

Thanks!

On Wed, Jun 14, 2017 at 10:25 AM, Gurr, Andrea N. <ang@bry.com> wrote:

Rachel,

I left you a voicemail, but wanted to follow up with an email to a question I have. Currently, Berry Petroleum
Company, LLCoperator status is inactive & being held up by 8 non-compliant wells. When Berry applied for active
operator status it was believed to PA these wells, however, after a review has been conducted upper management
has suggested altemate options. I would like to submit the new proposals for review, so my question to you is,
should I prepare each proposal on a Form 9 (oldschool paper form), and send them to Dayne, Dustin, and yourself?
Or should I submit electronically, selecting one of the Berry Petroleum options as operator in the E-permitting
system?

Trent Rosenlieb will be travelingto Utah next week and plans to visit your office, so I would like to get these to your
team and in review for discussion when he is there. Let me know your thoughts, I am happy to submit as you think
willwork best.

Thank you,

Andi

@ Andrea Gurr
leum
81%« Regulatory Specíalist II

4028 W. 4000 S.

Roosevelt, UT 84066

T:435.722.0065

C. 435.823.1846

Rachel Medina

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining

Bonding Technician

https://mail.google.com/maillcalu/1/9ui=2&ik=72fde6d6ad&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15cc24f340035adf&siml=15cac098f6e6ba13&siml=15cad142171de400&s...
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2017_06-1S_UDOGM letter re 8 non complaant wells.pdf
2304K

Rache! Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov> Thu, Jun 15,2017 at 12:46 PM
To: Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Here is Berry's shut in plans for the I non-compliance wells they will be taking, Can we complete the operator change?
[Quoted text hidden]

2017_06-1S_UDOGM letter re 8 non compliant wells.pdf
2304K

Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov> Mon, Jun 19,2017 at 3:43 PM
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah. gov>

Looks o.k. on any they are proposing to plug by Sept 15th and decide not to to put online by 2018, they will need MIT to
get an extension beyond sept
[Quoted text hidden]

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
801.538.5281 (ofc)
801.359.3%0 (fax)

web: www.ogm.utah.gov

https://mail.google.corn/mail/calu/11?ui=2&ik=721d"*"Ogr;"w=pt&search=inbox&th=15cc24B40035adf&siml=15cac0986e6ba13&siml=15cad142171de400&s... A3
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801-538-5260

2017_06-15_UDOGM letter re 8 non compliant wells.pdf
2304K

Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov> Thu, Jun 15, 2017 at 12:46 PM
To: Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Here is Berry's shut in plans for the 8 non-compliance wells they will be taking, Can we complete the operator change?
[Quoted text hidden]

2017_06-15_UDOGM Ietter re 8 non compliant wells.pdf
2304K

Dustin Doucet <dustindoucet@utah.gov> Mon, Jun 19, 2017 at 3:43 PM
To: Rachel Medina <rachelmedina@utah.gov>

Looks o.k. on any they are proposing to plug by Sept 15th and decide not to to put online by 2018, they will need MIT to
get an extension beyond sept
[Quoted text hidden]

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Ste 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84116
801.538.5281 (ofc)
801.359.3940 (fax)

web: www.ogm.utah.gov

https://mail.google.com/maillcalu/1/?ui=2&ik=72fde6d6ad&view=pt&search=inbox&th=15cc24f340035adf&siml=15cac098f6e6ba13&siml=15cad142171de400&s...



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATUML RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

UIC FORM 5

TRANSFER OF AUTHORITY TO INJECT
Well Name and Number

ZandT UteTribal2-21
Location

Footage : 759' FNL, 1978' FEL

NWNE 21 55 4W

EFFECTIVE DATE OF TRANSFER: 51112017

API Number

4301 331 280

County: Duchesne

State: UTAH

or
Brundage Canyon

Lease

14-20-H62-3414

CURRENT OPERATOR

Company:

Address:

Phone:

Comments:

Linn Operating, LLC Name:

Signature:

Title:

Date:

600 Travis Street, Suite 1400

611y Houston srate TX 2io77002 Regulatory Manager

(281) 840-4010 @q

NEW OPERATOR

Company: Berry Petroleum Company, LLC Name: Arthurl Sqith

Signature:Address: 5201 Truxtun Avenue

citv Bakersfield state CA ,ip 93309 Tile: Chief Executive Officer

Phone:

Comments:

Date: \'? Q\*! zss\l

(This space for State use only

Transfer approved by:

RECENED

MAY 
() S Zijli

D\V, OI O\t.'GAS 
&I\A\N\NG

(5/2000)

Approval Date:

STATE OF UTAH UICFORM5
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

TRANSFER OF AUTHORITY TO INJECT
Well Name and Number API Number
Z and T Ute Tribal 2-21 4301331280

Location of Well Field or UnitName
Brundage Canyon

Footage 759' FNL, 1978' FEL County : Duchesne
Lease Designation and Number

QQ, Section, Township, Range: NWNE 21 SS 4W State : UTAH 14-20-H62-3414

EFFECTIVE DATE OF TRANSFER: 5/1/2017

CURRENT OPERATOR

Company: Linn Operating, LLC Name: De gordon
Address: 600 Travis Street, Suite 1400 Signature:

city Houston state TX zip 77002 Title: Regulatory Manager

Phone: (281) 840-4010 Date:

Comments:

NEW OPERATOR

. Berry Petroleum Company, LLC Name: Arthur T. ithCompany.

Address: 5201 Truxtun Avenue Signature: \ \ N, -

city Bakersfield state CA zip 93309 Title: Chief Executive Officer

Phone: Date: N 14\

Comments:

(This space ferrap re uedebonly

Approval Date:

Comments:Title:
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