
RECEIVED: February 29, 2012

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

  
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME and NUMBER

Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX 

2. TYPE OF WORK

DRILL NEW WELL      REENTER P&A WELL      DEEPEN WELL   
3. FIELD OR WILDCAT

NATURAL BUTTES  

4. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well             Coalbed Methane Well: NO 

5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
CHAPITA WELLS  

6. NAME OF OPERATOR
EOG Resources, Inc. 

7. OPERATOR PHONE
435 781-9111 

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N, Denver, CO, 80202 

9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
kaylene_gardner@eogresources.com 

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER
(FEDERAL, INDIAN, OR STATE)

UTU0285A 

11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP

FEDERAL     INDIAN     STATE     FEE   
12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP

FEDERAL     INDIAN     STATE     FEE   

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee')
  

14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')

 

18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

YES   (Submit Commingling Application)    NO   

19. SLANT

   
VERTICAL    DIRECTIONAL    HORIZONTAL   

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 449 FNL   471 FEL  NENE  26  9.0 S  22.0 E  S 

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 659 FNL   19 FWL  NWNW  25  9.0 S  22.0 E  S 

At Total Depth 659 FNL   19 FWL  NWNW  25  9.0 S  22.0 E  S 

21. COUNTY
UINTAH  

22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet)
19 

23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
1800 

 
 

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL
(Applied For Drilling or Completed)

430 

26. PROPOSED DEPTH
MD: 9367     TVD: 9315 

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL

5015 

28. BOND NUMBER

NM2308 

29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

49-225 

Hole, Casing, and Cement Information

String Hole Size Casing Size Length Weight Grade & Thread Max Mud Wt. Cement Sacks Yield Weight

 SURF  12.25  9.625  0 - 2300  36.0   J-55 ST&C  10.5  Class G  150  3.82  11.0

               Class G  135  1.18  15.6

 PROD  7.875  4.5  0 - 9367  11.6   N-80 LT&C  10.5  Hi Lift "G"  130  3.91  11.0

               50/50 Poz  910  1.28  14.1

ATTACHMENTS
 

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES
 

 WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER  COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY DRILLED) TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

NAME Mickenzie Gates  TITLE Operations Clerk  PHONE 435 781-9145 

SIGNATURE DATE 02/14/2012  EMAIL mickenzie_gates@eogresources.com 

API NUMBER ASSIGNED

    43047523950000

    
Permit Manager 

APPROVAL

FORM 3

AMENDED REPORT

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

FORM 3
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES AMENDEDREPORT
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME aCnhdapNUaMRs
Unit 1542-26DX

2. TYPE OF WORK 3. FIELD OR WILDCAT
DRILLNEWWELL REENTER P&AWELL DEEPEN WELLI NATURALBUTTES

4. TYPE OF WELL 5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
Gas Well Coalbed Methane Well: NO CHAPITAWELLS

6. NAME OF OPERATOR 7. OPERATOR PHONE
EOG Resources, Inc. 435 781-9111

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N, Denver, CO, 80202 kaylene_gardner@eogresources.com

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER 11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP 12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
(FEDERAL,INDIAN,ORSTE)0285A FEDERAL INDIANISTATE FEE FEDERAL INDIAN STATE FEEI

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME 18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM 19. SLANT

(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

YES (Submit Commingling Application) NO VERTICAL DIRECTIONAL HORIZONTAL

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION ATSURFACE 449 FNL 471 FEL NENE 26 9.0 S 22.0 E S

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 659 FNL 19 FWL NWNW 25 9.0 S 22.0 E S

At Total Depth 659 FNL 19 FWL NWNW 25 9.0 S 22.0 E S

21. COUNTY 22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet) 23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
UINTAH 19 1800

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL 26. PROPOSED DEPTH
(Applied For Drilling or Completed) MD: 9367 TVD: 9315

430

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL 28. BOND NUMBER 29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATERI
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

5015 NM2308 49-225

Hole, Casing, and Cement Information

String Hole Size Casing Size Length Weight Grade & Thread Max Mud Wt. Cement Sacks Yield Weight

SURF 12.25 9.625 0 - 2300 36.0 J-55 ST&C 10.5 Class G 150 3.82 11.0

Class G 135 1.18 15.6

PROD 7.875 4.5 0 - 9367 11.6 N-80 LT&C 10.5 Hi Lift "G" 130 3.91 11.0

50/50 Poz 910 1.28 14.1

ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES

WELL PLATOR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT(IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLYOR HORIZONTALLY DRILLED) TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

NAME Mickenzie Gates TITLE Operations Clerk PHONE 435 781-9145

SIGNATURE DATE 02/14/2012 EMAIL mickenzie_gates@eogresources.com

API NUMBER ASSIGNED APPROVAL
43047523950000

Permit Manager

RECEIVED: February 29,



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

DRILLINGPLAN eogresources
MULTI-WELL PAD:

CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26DX, CWU 1543-26D,
CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D, CWU 1546-26D

NE/NE, SEC. 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M..
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

CWU 1541-26D CWU 1542-26D CWU 1543-26D CWU1544-26D

FORMATION TVD MD TVD MD TVD MD TVD MD
Green River 1540 1546 1514 1528 1517 1532 1520 1536

Birdsnest 1754 1762 1730 1750 1717 1735 1716 1743
Mahogany Oil Shale Bed 2296 2307 2281 2315 2276 2304 2268 2327

Wasatch 4653 4667 4625 4677 4617 4661 4600 4705
Chapita Wells 5241 5255 5215 5268 5208 5252 5193 5298
Buck Canyon 5903 5916 5870 5923 5852 5896 5812 5917

North Horn 6608 6622 6586 6639 6587 6632 6593 6698
KMVPrice River 6985 6998 6941 6994 6934 6978 6920 7025

KMV Price River Middle 7855 7868 7813 7865 7807 7851 7795 7900
KMV Price River Lower 8636 8650 8602 8654 8596 8640 8586 8691

Sego 9148 9162 9112 9164 9114 9158 9107 9212
TD 9350 9364 9315 9367 9315 9359 9310 9415

ANTICIPATED BHP (PSI) 5105 5086 5086 5083

CWU 1545-26D CWU 1546-26D

FORMATION TVD MD TVD MD
Green River 1530 1546 1543 1565

Birdsnest 1726 1750 1738 1770
Mahogany Oil Shale Bed 2280 2323 2288 2344

Wasatch 4623 4691 4641 4732
Chapita Wells 5213 5281 5229 5320
Buck Canyon 5852 5921 5886 5977

North Horn 6594 6662 6595 6686
KMVPrice River 6951 7020 6979 7070

KMVPrice River Middle 7821 7889 7843 7933
KMVPrice River Lower 8611 8679 8632 8722

Sego 9139 9208 9146 9237
TD 9340 9409 9350 9441

ANTICIPATED BHP (PSI) 5100 5105

1. Fresh Waters may exist in the upper, approximately 1,000 ft ± of the Green River Formation,
with top at about 2,000 ft ±.

2. Cement isolation is installed to surface of the well isolating all zones by cement.

8 point plan-EOG 1/5



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

DRILLINGPLAN eogresources
MULTI-WELL PAD:

CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26DX, CWU 1543-26D,
CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D, CWU 1546-26D

NE/NE, SEC. 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M..
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: Production Hole - 5000 Psig
BOP schematic diagrams attached.

4. CASINGPROGRAM:

Hole Rating Rating
Casing Size Length Size Weight Grade Thread Collapse Burst Tensile

Conductor 20" 0 - 60' 14" 32.5# A252 1800 PSI 10,000#

Surface 12 ¼" 0 - 2,300'± 9 ¾" 36.0# J-55 STC 2020 PSI 3520 PSI 394,000#

Production 7 7/8" Surface - TD 4 ½" 11.6# N-80 LTC 6350 PSI 7780 PSI 223,000#

12 ¼" surface hole will be drilled to a total depth of 200'± below the base of the Green River lost
circulation zone and cased w/9-¾" as shown to that depth. Drilled depth may be shallower or
deeper than the 2300' shown above depending on the actual depth of the loss zone.

All casinq will be new or inspected.

5. Float Equipment:

Surface Hole Procedure (0'-2300'±)

Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Centralizers: 1-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5th

jOint to surface. (15 total)

Production Hole Procedure (2300'±- TD):

Float shoe, 1 joint casing, float collar and balance of casing to surface. 4-½", 11.6#, N-80 or equivalent marker
collars or short casing joints to be placed at top of Price River and 400' above top of Wasatch. Centralizers to be
placed 5' above shoe on joint #1, top of joint#2, and every 3rd jointto 400' above the top of primary objective.
Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of float collar, and top of 2" joint.

6. MUD PROGRAM

Surface Hole Procedure (Surface - 2500'±):

Air/Air mist/Aerated water* (*Astandby water source will be available at all times to act
as a kill medium when conducting air drilling operations)

or
A closed-loop system utilizinga gelled bentonite mud willbe employed.
LCM sweeps, additions, etc. will be used as necessary.

8 point plan-EOG 2/5



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

DRILLINGPLAN eogresources
MULTI-WELL PAD:

CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26DX, CWU 1543-26D,
CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D, CWU 1546-26D

NE/NE, SEC. 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M..
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

Production Hole Procedure (2500'±- TD):

Anticipated mud weight 9.5-10.5 ppg depending on actul wellbore conditions encountered while
drilling.

2500'±- TD A closed mud system will be utilized. A bentonite gelled water mud system will be used to control
viscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay encapsulation/inhibition.
Water loss will be maintained at <15cc's using white starch or PAC. Bactericides will be used as
needed. Anticipated pH will range from 9.0-10.0. Mud weight will be adjusted as necessary for
well control. Deflocculants/thinners will be used as necessary to maintain mud quality. LCM
sweeps will be utilized as necessary to control lost circulation and mud loss. CO2 contamination,
if encountered, will be treated with lime and gypsum.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:

Reference: Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 - Section E: Special Drilling Operations

o EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring a straight run blooie line to be 100' in
length. (Where possible, a straight run blooie line will be used).

o EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length. To
reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be approximately 75' in length.

o EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations, during air drilling operations only, requiring
dedusting equipment. Dust during air drilling operations is controlled by water mist.

o EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations, during air drilling operations only, requiring an
automatic igniter or continuous pilot light on the blooie line. (Not required on aerated water system).

o EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance that compressors are located in the opposite direction from the
blooie line a minimum of 100 feet from the well bore. (Air Compressors are rig mounted).

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:

Logs: None
Cased-hole Logs: Cased-hole logs will be run in lieu of open-hole logs consisting of the following:

Cement Bond / Casing Collar Locator and Gamma Ray

8 point plan-EOG 3/5



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

DRILLINGPLAN eogresources
MULTI-WELL PAD:

CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26DX, CWU 1543-26D,
CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D, CWU 1546-26D

NE/NE, SEC. 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M..
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (Surface - 2300'±):

Lead: 150 sks Class "G" cement with 16% Gel, 10 #/sx Gilsonite, 3% Salt, 2% CaCl2,
3 lb/sx GR3 ¼ #/sx Flocele mixed at 11 ppg, 3.82 ft /sk. yield, 23 gps water.

Tail: 135 sks Class "G" cement with 2% CaCl2, ¼#/sk Flocele mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 ft3/sk.,
5.2 gps water.

Top Out: As necessary with Class "G" cement with 2% CaCl2, ¼#/sk Flocele mixed at 15.6
ppg, 1.18 R3/Sk., 5.2 gps water.

Note: The above number of sacks is based on gauge-hole calculation
Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to surface.
Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement to 500' above the shoe.

Production Hole Procedure (2300'±- TD)

Lead: 130 sks: Hi-Lift"G" w/12% D20 (Bentonite), 1% D79 (Extender), 5% D44
(Salt),0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.25% D112 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.25 pps D29
(cello flakes) mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.91 R3/Sk., 24.5 gps water.

Tail: 910 sks: 50:50 Poz "G" w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.075%
D13 (Retarder), 0.2% D167 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),
mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 ft3/sk., 5.9gps water.

Note: The above number of sacks is based on gauge-hole calculation.
Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to 200'± above 9-5/8" casing shoe.
Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement to 400'± above top of Wasatch.

Final Cement volumes will be based upon qauqe-hole plus 45% excess.

8 point plan-EOG 4/5



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

DRILLINGPLAN eogresources
MULTI-WELL PAD:

CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26DX, CWU 1543-26D,
CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D, CWU 1546-26D

NE/NE, SEC. 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M..
UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

Surface Hole (Surface - 2300'±):

Lost circulation

Production Hole (2300'±- TD):

Sloughing shales, lost circulation and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch
Formation.

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Upper and Lower Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title Ill in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds will be
used, produced, stored, transponed, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore,
no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used,
produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

13.Air Drillinq Operations:

1. Main Air Compressors are 1250 CFM 350 psi with 2000 psi Boosters and are rig mounted.

2. Secondary Air Compressors are 1170 CFM 350 psi with 2000 psi Boosters and are rig mounted.

3. Minimum setting depth of conductor casing will be 60' GL or 10'±into competent formation, whichever is
deeper, as determined by the EOG person in charge. Exceptions must be approved by an EOG drilling
superintendent or manager.

4. The diameter of the diveder flow line will be a minimum of 10" to help reduce back pressure on the well
bore during uncontrolled flow.

5. Rat and Mouse hole drilling willoccur only after surface casing has been set and cemented.

6. EOG Resources, Inc. will use a properly maintained and lubricated stripper head.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG 5/5



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000
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RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

EOG RESOURCES, INC.
CWU #1541-26D, #1542-26DX, #1543-26D, #1544-26D, #1545-26D & 1546-26D

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 26, T98, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHEASTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW OFEXISTINGACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHWESTERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying IDCATIONPHOTos 1 09 9 PHOTO
85 South 200 East Vemal, Utah 84078 0 DAY YE

sincei¾4 (435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813 TAKENW: GS. DRAWNBY:Z.L REV:



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

DS E:1C2-5009 EOG RESOURCES, INC° FIGURE #1|Drawn By· D.R.B· LOCATIONLAYOUTFOR I
Rev 11 -16-09 D.R.B.
Rev: 02-08-1,0 D.R.B.CWU #1541-26D, #1542-26DX, #1543-26D
Rev: 01 -30-12 D.R.e. #1544-26D, #1545-26D & #1546-26D

SECTION 26, T95, R22E, S.L.B.&M.C-5.5
, NE 1/4 NE 1/4

o

to Mo d 110

nsition ea o

d

Toe of Fi//

O turbance

Edge of pa

No. 1 1 1

Existing Pad su
.CW †546-260

.5
-----

U †541-22660

Ex/st/ng MW/ CW S54J-26D
55' yeas-2e 45 125' Sta. 1+50

c ps42 2eox

sooz o'

ppr

e

O PS

e

Transition
Line

/. 5015 0 und Corner

\ as need

-. Sta. 0+00

C- J.2' E-5.6'
B. 5009.7'a sors s 4

Existing Road
Existing Road g

Dev. Ungraded Ground at /154 Location Stake =5015. J UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
Finish Graded Dev. at /1543 Location Stake = 5015. J 86 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (436)



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

EOG RESOURCES, INC· FIGURE #2
°" x-section TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR '

tilitty
scale CWU #1541-26D, #1542-26DX, #1543-26D LAND /g

'¯

,,

#1544-26D, #1545-26D & #1546-26D 9/
1 = 50' SECTION 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. g No. 161 1

DATE: 10-20-09 NE 1/4 NE 1/4 ËË R .

Drawn By· D.R.B· YRev: 02-08-10 D.R.B.
Rev: 01-30-12 D.R.B.

110' 125. E Œ

Preconstruction
Grade 110' 125'

CUT CUT S/ope= 1 1/2:1

SM. 1+50
.....

110 125'

F/LL
¯

F/LL

SM. 0+75

110 125'

APPROX/MA7EACREAGES SM. 0+00
EX/ST WELLS/TE D/S7URBANCE = ±1.J41 ACRES
NEW WELLS/TE D/S7URBANCE = ±0.808 ACRES * NO TE:
(New Construction Only) F/LL QUANT/TY/NCLUDES

TOTAL= ±2.149 ACRES
5% FOR COMPACT/ON

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES DEFICITMATERIAL = <4,660>Cu. Yds.
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 590 Cu. Yds. Topsoil = 590 Cu. Yds.
(New Construction Only)

Remaining Location = 600 Cu. Yds. DEFICITUNBALANCE = <5,250>Cu. Yds.
(After Rehabilitation)

TOTAL CUT = 1,190 CU.YDS.
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

FILL = 5,850 CU.YDS. as so. zoo met • vemai. utan esore • (486)



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

EOG RESOURCES, INC. FIGURE #3
TYPICAL RIG LAYOUTFOR

CWU #1541-26D, #1542-26DX, #1543-26D LAND
SCALE: 1" = 50' #1544-26D, #1545-26D & #1546-26D
DATE: 10-20-09 SECTION 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
Drawn By· D.R.B· NE 1/4 NE 1/4 No.161 1

Rev· 02-08-10 D.R.B.
Rev: 01-30-12 D.R.B.

NOTE·
Flare Pit is to o
be /ocated a min. N
of 100' from the
Well Head.

CW /1546-260
PIPE RACKS

o CW // 45-2 D
In CW /1541-260
o CM/ /1544-260

Exk t/ng We// - CM/ /1543-260
55' AS-26 45' HOUSE

RIG CM/ /1542-26DX --

45'
Ex/st/ng Weli PUMP/J6-26

TOILET
MUDSHED

HOPPER

2POWER

TOOLS
STORAGE

FUEL TANK

TRASH b

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. 200 East * Vemal, UtaA 84078 * (436)



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

EOG RESOURCES, INC· FIGURE #4
PRODUCTIONFACILITYLAYOUTFOR ILil

CWU #1541-26D, #1542-26DX, #1543-26D
#1544-26D, #1545-26D & #1546-26D

SCALE: 1" = 50' SECTION 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. No.161 1
DATE: 10-20-09 NE 1/4 NE 1/4 : RDrawn By D.R.B.

Rev· 02-08-10 D.R.B. Y
Rev: 01-30-12 D.R.B.

& CF É

COMBOUNIT =

I =

|
|
|
|
|
|
|
| CW /1546-260

CW /1545-26D

CW /1541-260
CW /1544-260
CW /1543-260

OEx/st/ng Well/905-26
CW /1542-26DX

O Ex/st/ng Well
/J6-26

Access Road

RE-HABED AREA
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So, 200 Amst * Vemal, Utah 84078 * (435)



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

EOG RESOURCES
CWU #1541-26D, #1542-26DX, #1543-26D,

#1544-26D, #1545-26D & #1546-26D
SECTION 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL, UTAH ALONG U.S.
HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 14.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATE
HIGHWAY 88; EXIT LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 17.0 MILES TO OURAY, UTAH; PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3 MILES ON THE SEEP RIDGE
ROAD TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 12.3 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.7 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF
THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND
PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY l.9 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST;
TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN
EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.9
MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY, THEN
SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.9 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHWEST;
TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.25 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHWEST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 300' TO THE CWU #36-26
AND THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 50.8



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

PROPOSED LOCATION:
CWU #1541-26D, #1542-26DX, #154126D
#1544-26D,#1545-26D & #1546-26D .T9S

T10S '"%

LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
O PROPOSED LOCATION N

#154126D, #1544-26D #1545-26D & #154626D
SECTION 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

NE 1/4 NE 1/4

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 10 09 0985 South 200 East VernnI, Utah 84078 M A P DAY YEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1:100000 DRAWNBY·Z.L.REY:A.T.01-30-12



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

487/

955

23

PROPOSED LOCATION: sMe
CWU #1541-26D, #1542-26DX, #1543-26D,

T9s
LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.

EXISTINGRO2 N
#1543-2dD,#1544-26D #154426D & #1546-26D

SECITON26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
NE 1/4 NE 1/4

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 10 09 0985 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P nav vraa(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1"= 2000' DRAWNBY:Z.L REViA.T.01-30-12



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

E E

sasse suos sesessa
40 N 3 20 g 2·2

se se

PROPOSED LOCATION:
CWU #1541-26D, #1542-26DX, #1543-26D,
#154 26Dj1545-26D & #1546-26D

E ES

LS WATERWELLS
O PRODUCINGWELLS ABANDONED WELLS #1543-26D, #1544-26D #1545-26D & #1546-26D

SF£TION 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.SHUT IN WELLS TEMPORARILY ABANDONED NE 1/4 NE 1/4

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 10 09 0985 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P osv vtan(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1"= 2000' DRAWNBY:ZL. REV:



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

eog resources
EOG Resources
Uintah County Utah
Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU #1542-26DK10'East
Wellbore #1

Plan: Plan #1

Standard Planning Report
27 January,



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

EOG Resources
Ulntah County Utah

Chapita Well Unit 1541•1546-26D
CWU #1542-26D 10' East

Latitude 40' 0' 46.951 N
Longitude 109° 23' 55.512 WOg FOSOUTCOS WEU. @5034.0R (Odginal Well Elev)

Ground Level 5015.0
Utah Central 4302

NAD1927 (NADCONCONUS)
Magnetic North is 10.95* East of True North (Magnetic Declination)

FORMATIONTOP DETAILS WELLBORE TARGET DETAILS
ANNOTATlONS

TVDPath MDPath Formation Name TVD +N/-S +El-W Shape
TVD MD Annotation 1514.0 1538.2 Green River Top Wasatch #1542 (New Locatlor#625.0 -210.9 490.2 Polnt

120.0 120.0 KOP 2/100' 1730.0 1759.9 Birdsnest PBHL #1542 (New location) 9315.0 -210.9 490.2 Circle (Radius: 50.0)
764.4 770.0 Start Turn to target 2281.0 2325.4 Mohogany Shale

1220.6 1237.2 Start hold at 1237 MD 4625.0 4681.2 Wasatch
2447.6 2496.4 Start Drop -1.5/100' 5215.0 5271.2 Chapita Wells
3306.8 3363.0 Start hold at 3363' MD 5870.0 5926.2 Buck Canyon CASING DETAILS
9315.0 9371.2 TD at 9371' MD 6586.0 6642.2 North Hom

6941.0 6997.2 Price River TVD MD Name Size
9112.0 9168.2 Sego 2231.0 2274.1 Surface 9-5/8

9315.0 9371.2 Production 4-1/2

-750- --- - - - -
- I SECTION DETAILS- I

lee MD Inc Azi TVD +N/-S +El-W DLeg TFace VSec Target
0 , 1 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0

- KOP 2/100 2 120.0 0.00 0.00 120.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0
- 3 770.0 13.00 80.00 764.4 12.8 72.3 2.00 80.00 61.4- 4 1237.2 13.00 122.45 1220.6 ·6.4 168.6 100 110.73 157.4 Top Wasatch #1542 (New Locatlon

- Start m to;target 5 2496.4 13.00 122.45 2447.6 -158.4 407.6 0.00 0.00 437.0
750 - I e 3363.0 0.00 0.00 3306.8 -210.9 490.2 1.50 180.00 533.7

7 4681.2 0.00 0.00 4625.0 ·210.9 490.2 0.00 0.00 533.7 Top Wasatch #1542 (New Location
Start ud at 123T MD 8 9371.2 0.00 0.00 9315.0 -210.9 490.2 0.00 0.00 533.7 PBHL #1542 (New location)

Green River
rdsnest 1

Mohoganÿ Share Su ace -

M I rirnuths to e North2250- '-- - - -
arl Dro 1100'

Dip e: 65.88°
3000 Date: 12/01/26

Start hdd 3363' MD Model: 2010
600-

3750o

Wasatch Top Wasaich #1542
4500- - - -

K( P 2/100Q - - 200- - ----- -
ChadtaW Is _E . Sta TuF6totarget

Stort holdat 12 ThJ<5250 o -

tart Drop -1.5 1017
Blick Can n 0- -' - -

2 - ,- sd ihoaataser e
600 #154726 I 937 * AI

- North Horr 299 Project t
roductio' PribeRi e

6750 ,

PBHL#154 (Nevloca t i
-400- -

15- -

542-26D 10 East
7500 -- ---

1542-26D I :
-600- ' 300

400- 300 - -

D at 3 1 M
-1000

-15 15 30
PBHL #1 42 (New locaton) West(-)/East(+) (30 ftlin)9750-- -

CWut 1542-260 K East/Pan 1

- 600 -730 0 750 1500 -800 -600 -400 -200 0 200 4t!0 SIO

Vertical Section at 113.28° (1500 ftlin) West(-)/East(+) (400



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26D 10' East
Company: EOG Resources TVD Reference: WELL@5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: UIntah County Utah MD Reference: WELL@5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D North Reference: True
Well: CWU #1542-26D 10' East Sunrey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Plan #1

Project UIntah CountyUtah

Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah Central 4302

Site Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D

Site Position: Northing: 618,708.27ft Latitude: 40° O'46.951 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,588,474.21 ft Longitude: 109° 23' 55.640 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0 ft Slot Radlus: " Grid Convergence: 1.35 °

Well CWU #1542-26D 10' East

Well Positlon +N/-S 0.0 ft Northing: 618.708.50 ft Latitude: 40 O'46.951 N
+El-W 0.0 ft Easting: 2,588,484.21 ft Longitude: 109" 23' 55.512 W

Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 5,015.0ft

Wellbore Wellbore #1

Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength(°) (*) (nT)
IGRF2010 2012/01/26 10.95 65.88 52,287

Design Plan #1

Audit Notes:
Version: Phase: PROTOTYPE Tle On Depth: 0.0

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +N/-S +El·W Direction
(ft) (ft) (ft) (*)
0.0 0.0 0.0 113.28

Plan Sections

Measured Vertical Dogleg Bulld Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +N/-S +El-W Rate Rate Rate TFO

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (*/100ft) (*l100ft) (*l100ft) (*) Target

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
120.0 0.00 0.00 120.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
770.0 13.00 80.00 764.4 12.8 72.3 2.00 2.00 0.00 80.00

1,237.2 13.00 122.45 1,220.6 -6.4 168.6 2.00 0.00 9.09 110.73 Top Wasatch #154:
2,496.4 13.00 122.45 2,447.6 -158.4 407.6 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,363.0 0.00 0.00 3,306.8 -210.9 490.2 1.50 -1.50 0.00 180.00
4,681.2 0.00 0.00 4,625.0 -210.9 490.2 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 Top Wasatch #154:

L
9,371.2 0.00 0.00 9,315.0 -210.9 490.2 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 PBHL#1542 (New

2012/01/27 12:07 48PM Page 2 COMPASS 2003.16 Build



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

Planning Report

Database: EDM2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26D 10' East
Company: EOG Resources TVD Reference: WELL@5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: UIntah County Utah MD Reference: WELL@5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D North Reference: True
Well: CWU #1542-26D 10' East Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Plan #1

Planned Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Bulld Turn
Depth incilnation Azimuth Depth +N/-S +El·W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (*/100ft) (°l100ft) (*l100ft)

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
120.0 0.00 0.00 120.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

KOP 2/100'
200.0 1.60 80.00 200.0 0.2 1.1 0.9 2.00 2.00 0.00
300.0 3.60 80.00 299.9 1.0 5.6 4.7 2.00 2.00 0.00
400.0 5.60 80.00 399.6 2.4 13.5 11.4 2.00 2.00 0.00
500.0 7.60 80.00 498.9 4.4 24.8 21.0 2.00 2.00 0.00
600.0 9.60 80.00 597.8 7.0 39.5 33.5 2.00 2.00 0.00
700.0 11.60 80.00 696.0 10.2 57.6 48.9 2.00 2.00 0.00
770.0 13.00 80.00 764.4 12.8 72.3 61.4 2.00 2.00 0.00

Start Turn to target
800.0 12.80 82.53 793.7 13.8 78.9 67.1 2.00 -0.67 8.45
900.0 12.32 91.47 891.3 14.9 100.6 86.5 2.00 -0.48 8.94

1,000.0 12.15 100.89 989.0 12.7 121.6 106.7 2.00 -0.17 9.42
1,100.0 12.30 110.32 1,086.8 7.0 141.9 127.6 2.00 0.15 9.43
1,200.0 12.76 119.30 1,184.4 -2.1 161.5 149.2 2.00 0.46 8.98
1,237.2 13.00 122.45 1,220.6 -6.4 168.6 157.4 2.00 0.66 8.48

Start hold at 123T MD
1,300.0 13.00 122.45 1,281.9 -13.9 180.5 171.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,400.0 13.00 122.45 1,379.3 -26.0 199.5 193.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,500.0 13.00 122.45 1,476.7 -38.1 218.5 215.8 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,538.2 13.00 122.45 1,514.0 -42.7 225.8 224.3 0.00 0.00 0.00

Green River
1,600.0 13.00 122.45 1,574.2 -50.2 237.5 238.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,700.0 13.00 122.45 1,671.6 -62.2 256.5 260.2 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,759.9 13.00 122.45 1,730.0 -69.5 267.8 273.5 0.00 0.00 0.00

Blrdenest
1,800.0 13.00 122.45 1,769.0 -74.3 275.4 282.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,900.0 13.00 122.45 1,866.5 -86.4 294.4 304.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,000.0 13.00 122.45 1,963.9 -98.4 313.4 326.8 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,100.0 13.00 122.45 2,061.4 -110.5 332.4 349.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,200.0 13.00 122.45 2,158.8 -122.6 351.4 371.2 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,274.1 13.00 122.45 2,231.0 -131.5 365.4 387.7 0.00 0.00 0.00

Sulface
2,300.0 13.00 122.45 2,256.2 -134.7 370.4 393.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,325.4 13.00 122.45 2,281.0 -137.7 375.2 399.1 0.00 0.00 0.00

Mohogany Shale
2,400.0 13.00 122.45 2,353.7 -146.7 389.3 415.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,496.4 13.00 122.45 2,447.6 -158.4 407.6 437.0 0.00 0.00 0.00

Start Drop -1.5/100'

2,500.0 12.95 122.45 2,451.1 -158.8 408.3 437.8 1.50 -1.50 0.00
2,600.0 11.45 122.45 2,548.8 -170.1 426.1 458.7 1.50 -1.50 0.00
2,700.0 9.95 122.45 2,647.1 -180.1 441.8 477.0 1.50 -1.50 0.00
2,800.0 8.45 122.45 2,745.8 -188.7 455.3 492.8 1.50 -1.50 0.00
2,900.0 6.95 122.45 2,844.9 -195.9 466.6 506.0 1.50 -1.50 0.00
3,000.0 5.45 122.45 2,944.3 -201.6 475.7 516.7 1.50 -1.50 0.00
3,100.0 3.95 122.45 3,044.0 -206.0 482.6 524.7 1.50 -1.50 0.00
3,200.0 2.45 122.45 3,143.8 -209.0 487.3 530.2 1.50 -1.50 0.00
3,300.0 0.95 122.45 3,243.8 -210.6 489.8 533.2 1.50 -1.50 0.00
3,363.0 0.00 0.00 3,306.8 -210.9 490.2 533.7 1.50 -1.50 0.00

Start hold at 3363' MD
| 4.681.2 0.00 0.00 _ _4 625.0 -210.9 490.2 533.7 0.00 0.00 0.00

2012/01/27 12:07:48PM Page 3 COMPASS 2003.16 Build



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

Planning Reporteog resources
Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26D 10' East
Company: EOG Resources TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: UIntah County Utah MD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D North Reference: True
Well: CWU #1542-26D 10' East Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Plan #1

Planned Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +N/-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (°) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°l100ft) (°l100ft) (°l100ft)

Wasatch - Top Wasatch #1542 (New Location) - Top Wasatch #1542 (New Location)
5,271.2 0.00 0.00 5,215.0 -210.9 490.2 533.7 0.00 0.00 0.00

Chapita Wells
5,926.2 0.00 0.00 5,870.0 -210.9 490.2 533.7 0.00 0.00 0.00

Buck Canyon

6,642.2 0.00 0.00 6,586.0 -210.9 490.2 533.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
North Horn

6,997.2 0.00 0.00 6,941.0 -210.9 490.2 533.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
Price River

9,168.2 0.00 0.00 9,112.0 -210.9 490.2 533.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
Sego

9,371.2 0.00 0.00 9,315.0 -210.9 490.2 533.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
TD at 9371' MD - PBHL #1542 (New location)

Targets

Target Name
- hit/miss target Dip Angle Dip Dir. TVD +N/-S +E/-W Northing Easting
- Shape (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

PBHL #1542 (New loc 0.00 0.00 9,315.0 -210.9 490.2 618,509.18 2,588,979.27 40° O'44.867 N 109 23' 49.211 W
- plan hits target center
- Circle (radius 50.0)

Top Wasatch #1542 ( 0.00 0.00 4,625.0 -210.9 490.2 618,509.18 2,588,979.27 40° O'44.867 N 109 23' 49 211 W
- plan hits target center
- Point

Casing Points

Measured Vertical Casing Hole
Depth Depth Diameter Diameter

(ft) (ft) Name (") (")
2,274.1 2,231.0 Surface 9-5/8 12-1/4
9,371.2 9,315.0 Production 4-1/2 7-7/8

Formations

Measured Vertical Dip
Depth Depth Dip Direction

(II) ( ) Name Lithology (°)
4,681.2 4,625.0 Wasatch 0.00
9,168.2 9,112.0 Sego 0.00
6,997.2 6,941.0 Price River 0.00
1,538.2 1,514.0 Green River 0.00
6,642.2 6,586.0 North Hom 0.00
1,759.9 1,730.0 Birdsnest 0.00
5,926.2 5,870.0 Buck Canyon 0.00
5,271.2 5,215.0 Chapita Wells 0.00
2,325.4 2,281.0 Mohogany Shale 0.00

2012/01/27 12:07:48PM Page 4 COMPASS 2003.16 Build
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API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

Planning Reportog resources
Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26D 10' East
Company: EOG Resources TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: UIntah County Utah MD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (OrigInalWell Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D North Reference: True
Well: CWU #1542-26D 10' East Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Plan #1

Plan Annotations

Measured Vertical Local Coordinates
Depth Depth +N/-8 +El-W

(ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Comment
120.0 120.0 0.0 0.0 KOP 2/100'
770.0 764.4 12.8 72.3 Start Tum to target

1,237.2 1,220.6 -6.4 168.6 Start hold at 1237' MD
2,496.4 2,447.6 -158.4 407.6 Start Drop -1.5/100'

3,363.0 3,306.8 -210.9 490.2 Start hold at 3363' MD
9,371.2 9,315.0 -210.9 490.2 TD at 9371' MD i

2012/01/27 12:07:48PM Page 5 COMPASS 2003.16 Build
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API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

eog resources
EOG Resources
Uintah County Utah
Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU #1542-26DX10'East
We11bore #1
Plan #1

Anticollision Report

27 January,
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API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

Anticollision ReportWeog resources
Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26D 10' East
Project: UIntah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL@5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Reference Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL@5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site Error: 0.0ft North Reference: True
Reference Well: CWU #1542-26D 10' East Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Well Error: 0.0ft Output errors are at 2.00 sigma
Reference Wellbore Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db
Reference Design: Plan #1 OFFsetTVD Reference: Offset Datum

Reference Plan #1

Filter type: NO GLOBALFILTER: Using user defined selection &filtering criteria
Interpolation Method: MD Interval 100.0ft Error Model: ISCWSA
Depth Range: Unlimited Scan Method: Closest Approach 3D
Results Limited by: Maximum center-center distance of 100.0ft Error Surface: EllipticalConic
Warning Levels Evaluated at: 2.00 Sigma

Survey Tool Program Date 2012/01/27

From To
(ft) (ft) Survey (Wellbore) Tool Name Description

0.0 9.371.2 Plan #1 (Wellbore #1) MWD MWD - Standard

Summary

Reference Offset Distance
Measured Measured Between Between Separation Warning

Site Name Depth Depth Centres Ellipses Factor
Offset Well - Wellbore - Design (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft)

Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU #1542-26D - Wellbore #1 - Wellbore #1 200.0 200.2 8.3 7.8 15.565 CC, ES
CWU #1542-26D - Wellbore #1 - Wellbore #1 1,600.6 1,598.0 45.7 35.0 4.277 SF

Offset Design Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D - CWU #1542-26D - Wellbore #1 - Wellbore #1 Offset Site Error: 0.0û
Survey Program: 387-MWD Offset Well Error: 0,0ft

Reference Offset Semi Major Axis Distance
Measured Vertical Measured Vertical Reference Offset Azimuth Offset Wellbore Centre Between Between MInlmum Separation Warning

Depth Depth Depth Depth from North +FU-8 +El-W Centres Ellipses Separation Factor

0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 -90.00 0.0 -10.0 10.0
100.0 100.0 100.1 100.1 0.1 0,1 -90.94 -0.2 -9.3 9.3 9.1 0.21 44.493
199.1 199.1 199.3 199.3 0.3 0.2 -95,61 -0.6 -7.2 8.6 8.1 0.53 16.176
200.0 200.0 200.2 200.2 0.3 0.2 -95.53 -0.6 -7.2 8.3 7.8 0.53 15.565 CC, ES
300.0 299.9 300.3 300.3 0.5 0.4 -104.30 -1.4 -3.6 9.5 8.6 0.87 10.938
400.0 399.6 400.5 400.3 0.8 0.5 -111.62 -2.4 1.4 13.0 11.8 1.24 10.500

500.0 498.9 501.1 500.4 1.1 0.8 -121.96 -4.3 11.0 16.4 14.6 1.75 9.340
600.0 597.8 601.1 599.3 1.4 1.1 -136.03 -7.8 25.2 20.6 18.2 2.39 8.647
700.0 696.0 700.4 697.2 1.8 1.5 -144.41 -13.6 40.6 29.3 26.1 3.11 9.408
800.0 793.7 799.9 795.1 2.2 1.9 -147.67 -20.4 57.3 40.5 36.6 3.88 10.439
900.0 891.3 899.7 892.9 2.6 2.3 -149.56 -27.7 75.5 49.5 44.8 4.66 10.614

1,000.0 989.0 999.8 990.7 3.0 2.7 -151.61 -35.3 95.7 54.5 49.0 5.51 9.892
1,100.0 1,086.8 1,099.3 1,087.8 3.4 3.1 -152.79 -43.3 116.0 56.6 50.2 6.34 8.930
1,200.0 1,184.4 1,198.6 1,184.8 3.8 3.5 -152.22 -52.1 135.2 56.5 49.4 7.15 7.900
1,300.0 1,281.9 1,298.8 1,282.6 4.3 4.0 -151.46 -61.4 154.7 54.0 46.0 8.02 6.729
1,400.0 1,379.3 1,398.7 1,380.1 4.7 4.4 -150.55 -70.6 174.4 51.2 42.3 8.88 5.762

1,500.0 1,476.7 1,498.7 1,477.8 5.1 4.8 -149.40 -79.9 193.8 48.6 38.9 9.75 4.984
1,600.0 1,574.2 1,598.0 1,574.6 5.6 5.3 -148.95 -89.3 213.9 45.7 35.0 10.67 4.279
1,600.6 1,574.8 1,598.0 1,574.6 5.6 5.3 -148.78 -89.3 213.9 45.7 35.0 10.68 4.277 SF

CC - Mincentre to center distance or covergent point, SF - min separation factor, ES- min ellipse separation
2012/01/27 12:09:18PM Page 2 of 3 COMPASS 2003.16 Build



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

Anticollision ReportWeog resources
Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26D 10' East
Project: UIntah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL@5034,0ft (Original Well Elev)
Reference Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL@5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site Error: 0.0ft North Reference: True
Reference Well: CWU #1542-26D 10' East Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Well Error: 0.0ft Output errors are at 2.00 sigma
Reference Wellbore Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db
Reference Design: Plan #1 Offset TVD Reference: Offset Datum

Reference Depths are relative to WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)Coordinates are relative to: CWU #1542-26D 10' East
Offset Depths are relative to Offset Datum Coordinate System is US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution), Utah Central 4302
Central Meridian is 111 30' 0.000 W ° Grid Convergence at Surface is: 1.35°

Ladder
, Pk t ,

60 '
I I

45
I

I I I
i i i
I I I I I

15

I i I I I I
I i I I I I
I i I i I i
I i I I I I
I I i I i i

1 3(0 610 9110 1200 1500 18]O
Measured Depth

LEGEND

g CWU #1542-260. Wellbore #1, Wellbore #1 V0

CC - Min centre to center distance or covergent point, SF - min separation factor, ES- min ellipse separation
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API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

eog resources

Chapita We/Is UnIt 1541-260 through 1646-260
Surface Use Plan

SectIon 26, T98, R22E
Uintah County, Utah

EOG Resources, Inc.'s (EOG) conventional oillgaswells are located approximately51.3miles south of Vernal, Utah withinUintah County. This project consistsofsix (6) newwells tobe constructedon the existingwellpad for Chapita Wells Unit905-26, and Chapita Wells Unit36-26.

The proposed wells are located on federal surface. Title to the oiland gas mineral interestis federally owned and is administeredby the Vernal Field Officeof the Bureau of LandManagement (BLM).

The proposed wells are conventional gas wells producing from the Mesaverde formation.Unproductive drill holes willbe plugged and abandoned as soon as evaluationof the productionintervals is conclusive.

This projectapplies to the following new proposed wells.
Well Name & Number QTR Section Township Range Total DepthChapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1541-26D
Chapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1542-26D
Chapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1543-26D
Chapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1544-26D
Chapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1545-26D
Chapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1546-26D

The pgoposed action is to directionallydrill five conventional gas wiellsfothe Mesaverdeformation.
The próposed action involves:

Activity Length (ft) Width (ft) Acres of Disturbance
Existinq Disturbance 270 180 2.469

New Disturbance 300 70 0.48Cut/fills&Topsoil/spoil
Varies Variesstockpile

Access Road Existing Existing 0Total New Disturbance



RECEIVED: February 14, 2012

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000
Chap/ta Wells Unit 1541-260 through 1646-260
Surface Use Plan Page 2

EOG willbuild each pad to accommodate up to six wells. The acres of disturbance providedabove are the maximum disturbance expected for each pad.

The proposed well locations require the construction of six (6) engineered (cut&fill)well pads.The total surface disturbance associated with the construction of these locations isapproximately2.95 acres. This figure includes disturbance associated with the well pads, thespoil and topsoilsstorage areas, and the construction equipmentand vehicle disturbance.

1. EXISTING ROADS:

Refer to Sheet # 4 and Sheet # 5 for location ofexistingaccess roads.

The proposed locations are approximately50.8 miles from Vernal, Utah.

Directions to the proposed locations are provided on the front page of the location plats.
The existing roads willbe maintained in the same or better condition as existedprior to thecommencementofoperations.Maintenance of the roads to the proposed locations willcontinue untilabandonment and reclamation of the wells,

A federal road right ofway is not required, Uintah County roads and authorized Unitroadswillbe used to access the proposed wellsite.

2. Access Roads to be Constructed:

No new roads willbe required to access the proposed well site.

Roads and associated drainage structureswillbe maintained in accordancewithguidelinescontained in the jointBLM/USFSpublication: Surface Operatíng Standards for Oiland GasExplorationand Development, Fourth Edition,and/orBLM Manual Section 9113 concerningroad constructionstandards on projects subject to federal jurisdiction. During the drillingand production phase of operations, the road surface and shoulders willbe kept in a safeand useable condition and drainage ditches and culvertswillbe kept clear and free flowing.
If existing access road, proposed access road and/or well pad are dry during construction,drilling and/or completion activities, water willbe applied to help facilitate compaction duringconstruction and to minimize soil loss as a result of wind erosion.

3. LOCATION oF EXISTING WELLS WITHINA ÛNE-MILE RADIUS:

Please refer to Topo C for the location of e>dstingwells withina one-inife=radiusof theproposed wells.

4. LocATioN oF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED PRODUCTION FACILITIES:

See the proposed Production Facilíty Layoutdiagrams showingthe proposed productionfacilities to be utilized on Figure 3.

Allproduction facilities willbe located on the disturbed portion of the well pad and at aminimumof 25 feet from the toe of the back slope.

Allpermanent (on site for six months or longer) structures constructed or installed
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API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

Chapita We/Is Unit 15f "RD through 1646-26D
Surface Use Plan Page 3

pumping units) willbe painted a flat, non-reflective, earthtonecolorto match one ofthe
standard environmental colors, as determined by the Rocky Mountain Five State
Interagency Committee. All facilities willbe painted within6 months of installation. AII
facilities will be painted with Carlsbad Canyon. Facilities required to complywith
O.S.H.A. (Occupational Safety and Health Act) willbe excluded

Containment berms willbe constructedcompletely around production facilities designed to
hold fluids (i.e., production tanks, produced water tanks, and/or heater/treater). The
containment berms willbe constructed of compacted subsoil, be sufficientlyimpervious, hold
110 percent of the capacityofthe largest tank, and be independent ofthe back cut.
All safety measures have been considered in the design, construction, operation,and
maintenance of the facility. EOG willhave a designated representative present during
construction. Any accidentstopersons or property on federal lands willimmediately be
reported to the Authorized Officer.

Production facilities will be set on location if the wells are successfully completed for
production. Facilities willconsist of wellhead valves, combo separator-dehy unit with meter,two (2) to eight (8) 400-bbl and one (1) 300-bbl vertical tanks and attachingpiping.

Gas gathering lines - A 4" gathering line willbe buried from dehy to the edge of the location.

5. LOCATION AND TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY:

Water supply willbe Bonanza Power Plant water source in Sec 26, TSS, R23E, Uintah
County, UT (State Water Right # 49-225(A31368)).

Water will be hauled by a licensed trucking company.

No water well willbe drilledon lease.

6. SOURCE OF ÛONSTRUCTION MATERIALS:

Any construction materials that may be required for surfacingof the drillpads and accessroads willbe obtainedfrom a contractor having a permitted source of materials withinthe
general area.

No construction materials will be removed from Federal or Indian lands without prior
approval from the appropriate surface management agency.

7. METHODBOF ÑANDLIAtaWASTE DISPOSAL:

Cuttings and drilling fluids willbe contained within the closed loop system. Cutting willbe
dried on site hauled to an authorized disposal site and/or spread on the access road and
well pad.

Fracture stimulation fluids willbe flowed back into (above ground tanks) closed loop system
and hauled to a DEQauthorized disposal site

A portable toilet willbe provided for human waste during the drilling and completionof thewell. Disposal willbe at an authorized
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API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000
Chap/ta We/Is UnIt 1641-260 through 1546-26D
Surface Use Plan '

Page 4

well. Disposal willbe at an authorizedsite.

All garbage and non-flammable waste materials will be contained in a self-contained,portable dumpster or trash cage. Upon completion of operations, or as needed, theaccumulated trash willbe transportedto a state approved waste disposal site. No trash willbe placed in the reserve pit.

Immediately after removal of the drilling rig, all debris and other waste materials notcontained in the trash cage will be cleaned up and removed from the location. Nopotentially adverse materialsor substances willbe left on the location. Anyopen pitswillbefenced during drilling operations and said fencing willbe maintaineduntil such time as thepits have been backfilled.

EOG Resources, Inc. maintains a file, per 29 CFR 1910.1200 (g)containing currentMaterialSafety Data Sheets (MSDS) for all chemicals, compounds, and/or substances which areused during the course of construction,drilling, completion, and production operations forthis project. Hazardous materials (substances) which may be found at the site may includedrilling mud and cementing products which are primarily inhalation hazards, fuels(flammable and/or combustible), materials that may be necessary for well completion/stimulation activities such as flammable or combustible substances and acids/gels(corrosives). The opportunityfor Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization Act (SARA)listed Extremely Hazardous Substances (EHS) at the site is generally limited to proprietarytreatingchemicals. All hazardous and EHS and commercial preparations willbe handled inan appropriate manner to minimize the potential for leaks or spillsto the environment.
8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES:

None anticipated.

9. WELL SITE LAYOUT:

See the attached diagrams showing the proposed drill pad cross sectionsand cut and fills inrelation to topographicfeatures as wellas access onto the pad and soil stockpiles.
All equipment and vehicles will be confined to the approved disturbed areas of this APD(i.e., access road, well pad, and spoil and topsoilstorage areas).
If necessary, in order to divert surface runoff,a drainage ditch willbe constructed aroundtheupslope side of the well site.

The fillsection of the pad that supports the drilling rig and any othkheavy equipment willbecompacted.

Closed Loop System:

The closed loop system willbe installed in a mannerthat preventing leaks, breaks, ordischarge. Drillcutting willbe contained in an area approximately 50' x 100'. The surfacedrill cuttings pile willbe bermed and lined withbentonite. Drillcuttings willbe dried andspread on location. More stringent protective requirements may be deemed necessary bythe A.O.

The closed loop system will be constructed in a way that minimizes the accumulation
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API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

Chapita We/Is Unit 15/ "4D through 1546-26D (
Surface Use Plan Page 6

The reclaimed locations and access roads willbe re-seeded with the recommendedseed mixture.

Monitoring willbe conductedby a qualified Operator representative (in coordinationwiththe BLM)following initial rehabilitationwork. Monitoring areas willbe re-examined at theend of the first growing season. Results willbe documented in a report to the BLM.
Problem areas identified during monitoringwillreceive follow-up rehabilitation/erosion
control measures. The seeding shallbe repeated untila satisfactory stand, as
determined by the authorized officer, is obtained.

11.SURFACE OWNERSHIP:

Surface ownership ofthe proposed well sites, is as follows:

Bureau of Land Management

12.OTHER INFORMATION:

All lease and/or unit operations willbe conducted in such a manner that fullcomplianceismade withallapplicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oiland Gas Orders, the approvedPlanof Operations, and any applicable Notice of Lessees. The operator is fully responsible forthe actions of its subcontractors. A complete copy of the approved "Application for Permit toDrill"willbe furnished to the field representative(s)to ensure compliance and shall be on
location during allconstruction and drilling operations.

Weeds willbe controlled on disturbed areas withinthe exteriorlimits ofthe access road and
well pad. The control methods shallbe in accordancewith guidelines established by the
EPA, BLM, state, and local authorities. Approval willbe obtained from the Authorized
Officerprior to use of pesticides.

EOG willinform allpersons in the area who are associated with this project that theymay besubject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing historic or archaeological sites or for
collectingartifacts. If historic or archaeologicalmaterials are uncovered during construction,the operatorwillimmediately stop work that might further disturb such materials and contactthe Authorized officer. Ifthe operator wishes, at any time,to relocate activitiesto avoid theexpense of mitigation and/or the delays associated withthis process, the Authorized Officerwillassume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilizationof the exposed
materials may be required. Otherwise the operatorwillbe responsible for mitigationcosts.
The Authorized Officer will provide technicaland procedural guideliries.for the conduct ofmitigation. Upon verification from the Authorized Officerthat reqµiredn1\tigationhas beencompleted, the operator willthen beallowed to resume constructiom.

A cultural resources survey was conductedand submitted by Montgomery Archaeological
Consultants on 7/11/2007. A paleontological survey was conducted and submitted by
Intermountain Paleo on
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API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

Chapita We/Is Unit 1541-26D through 1546-26D
Surface Use Plan Page 7

LESSEE OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND ÛERTIFICATION:

PERMITTING AGENT
Mickenzie Gates
EOG Resources, Inc.
1060 East Highway 40
Vernal, UT 84078
(435) 781-9145

All lease and/or unit operations willbe conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approved plan
of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for the
actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions willbe furnished to the field
representative to insure compliance.

The operator or his/her contractor shall contact the BLMoffice at (435) 781-4400 forty-eight
(48) hours prior to construction
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API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

Chapita Wells Unit 1541-260 through 1546-26D
Surface Use Plan Page 8

CERTIFICATION:

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed
drill site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein willbe performed by EOG Resources,
Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors in conformitywith this plan and the terms and
conditions under which it is approved. This statement is subject to the provisions of 18
U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

Please be advised that EOG Resources, Inc. is considered to be the operator of the
referenced wells, located in the NENE, of Section 26, T9S, R22E, Uintah County, Utah;
Federal land and minerals; and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease
for the operations conducted upon the leased lands. Bond Coverage is under Bond # NM
2308.

February 9, 2012 AI)
Date MicMmzie Gates, Regulatory
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EOG RESOURCES CHOKE MANIFOLDCONFIGURATION PAGE20F2
W/ 5,000 PSI WP VALVES

3" MIN. ID TO 3" MIN. ID BLEED 3" MIN. ID TO
SEPARATOR, OR PIT LINE TO PIT u,,,, SEPARATOR, OR PIT

MANUAL
CHOKE

ADJUSTABLE

4" 5,000 PSI CHOKE
LINE FROM HCR

VALVE

Testing Procedure:
1. BOP will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2.
2. Blind and Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5,000 psi.
3. Annular Preventer will be tested to 50% working pressure, 2,500 psi.

Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi / ft. or 1,500 psi. Not to exceed 70% of burst strength,
whichever is greater.

4. All lines subject to well pressure will be tested to the same pressure as blind and pipe rams.
5. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2
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Well Name: Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX
API Number: 4304752395
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RECEIVED: February 29, 2012

WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 2 /14 /2012 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43047523950000

WELL NAME: Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX    

OPERATOR: EOG Resources, Inc. (N9550) PHONE NUMBER: 435 781-9145

CONTACT: Mickenzie Gates    

PROPOSED LOCATION: NENE 26 090S 220E Permit Tech Review:

SURFACE: 0449 FNL 0471 FEL Engineering Review:

BOTTOM: 0659 FNL 0019 FWL Geology Review:

COUNTY: UINTAH 

LATITUDE: 40.01303 LONGITUDE: -109.39937

UTM SURF EASTINGS: 636606.00 NORTHINGS: 4430430.00

FIELD NAME: NATURAL BUTTES    

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal    

LEASE NUMBER: UTU0285A             PROPOSED PRODUCING FORMATION(S): MESA VERDE 

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE: NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

PLAT R649-2 -3 .

Bond: FEDERAL - NM2308      Unit:  CHAPITA WELLS 

Potash R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5      

Oil Shale 190-3 R649-3-3. Exception

Oil Shale 190-13  Drilling Unit 

Water Permit: 49-225           Board Cause No:  Cause 179-8

RDCC Review:           Effective Date:   8 /10/1999

Fee Surface Agreement           Siting:  Suspends General Siting

Intent to Commingle R649-3-11. Directional Drill

 Commingling Approved  

Comments:          Presite Completed
                  RIGSKID FR 4304751743: 

Stipulations:         4 - Federal Approval - dmason
                             15 - Directional - dmason
                             17 - Oil Shale 190-5(b) - dmason
                             22 - Rigskid - bhill

API Well Number: 43047523950000API Well Number: 43047523950000

WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

I

I

APD RECEIVED: 2/14/2012 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43047523950000

WELL NAME: Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX

OPERATOR: EOG Resources, Inc. (N9550) PHONE NUMBER: 435 781-9145

CONTACT: Mickenzie Gates

PROPOSED LOCATION: NENE 26 090S 220E Permit Tech Review:

SURFACE: 0449 FNL 0471 FEL Engineering Review:

BOTTOM: 0659 FNL 0019 FWL Geology Review:

COUNTY: UINTAH

LATITUDE: 40.01303 LONGITUDE: -109.39937

UTM SURF EASTINGS: 636606.00 NORTHINGS: 4430430.00

FIELD NAME: NATURALBUTTES

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: UTUO285A PROPOSED PRODUCING FORMATION(S): MESAVERDE

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE: NO

I

RECEIVED ANDIOR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

PLAT R649-2-3.

Bond: FEDERAL - NM2308 Unit: CHAPITAWELLS

Potash R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5

Oil Shale 190-3 R649-3-3. Exception

Oil Shale 190-13 Drilling Unit

Water Permit: 49-225 Board Cause No: Cause 179-8

RDCC Review: Effective Date: 8/10/1999

Fee Surface Agreement Siting: Suspends General Siting

Intent to Commingle R649-3-11. Directional Drill

Commingling Approved

I

Comments: Presite Completed
RIGSKID FR 4304751743:

Stipulations: 4 - Federal Approval - dmason
15 - Directional - dmason
17 - Oil Shale 190-5(b) - dmason
22 - Rigskid - bhill

RECEIVED: February 29,



Permit To Drill
******************

Well Name:   Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX
API Well Number:   43047523950000

Lease Number:  UTU0285A
Surface Owner:   FEDERAL 
Approval Date:    2 / 2 9 / 2 0 1 2

Issued to:
EOG Resources, Inc., 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N, Denver, CO 80202

Authority:
Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. 40-6-1 et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et
seq., the Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit
to drill the listed well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of
Cause 179-8. The expected producing formation or pool is the MESA VERDE
Formation(s), completion into any other zones will require filing a Sundry Notice (Form
9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool will require approval in
accordance with R649-3-22.

Duration:
This approval shall  expire one year from the above date unless substantial  and
continuous operat ion is  underway,  or  a  request  for  extension is  made prior  to the
expirat ion date

General:
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq.,  the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules,  and the applicable terms and provisions of the
approved Application for permit to dril l .

Conditions of Approval:
State approval of this well  does not supercede the required federal  approval,  which
must be obtained prior to dri l l ing.  

In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall
submit a complete angular deviation and directional survey report  to the Division
within 30 days following completion of the well.  

In accordance with the Order in Cause No. 190-5(b) dated October 28, 1982, the
operator  shal l  comply with  the requirements  of  Rules  R649-3-31 and R649-3-27
pertaining to Designated Oil Shale Areas. Additionally, the operators shall ensure
that  the surface and or production casing is  properly cemented over the entire oil
shale section as defined by Rule R649-3-31.  The Operator shall  report  the actual
depth the oil  shale is  encountered to the division. 

All conditions of approval in the Statement of Basis and RDCC comments from the
CWU 1542-26D well permit apply to the CWU 1542-26DX well.

API Well No: 43047523950000API Well No: 43047523950000

State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

- -/ MICHAELR.STYLER

GAR'R H BERT
ExoutimDrotor

comrmr Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieuterant Gowrær Busion Director

Permit To Drill
kkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkk

Well Name: Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX
API Well Number: 43047523950000

Lease Number: UTUO285A
Surface Owner: FEDERAL
Approval Date: 2/29/20 12

Issued to:
EOG Resources, Inc., 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N, Denver, CO 80202

Authority:
Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. 40-6-1 et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et
seq., the Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit
to drill the listed well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of
Cause 179-8. The expected producing formation or pool is the MESA VERDE
Formation(s), completion into any other zones will require filing a Sundry Notice (Form
9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool will require approval in
accordance with R649-3-22.

Duration:
This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date

General:
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the
approved Application for permit to drill.

Conditions of Approval:
State approval of this well does not supercede the required federal approval, which
must be obtained prior to drilling.

In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall
submit a complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division
within 30 days following completion of the well.

In accordance with the Order in Cause No. 190-5(b) dated October 28, 1982, the
operator shall comply with the requirements of Rules R649-3-31 and R649-3-27
pertaining to Designated Oil Shale Areas. Additionally, the operators shall ensure
that the surface and or production casing is properly cemented over the entire oil
shale section as defined by Rule R649-3-31. The Operator shall report the actual
depth the oil shale is encountered to the division.

All conditions of approval in the Statement of Basis and RDCC comments from the
CWU 1542-26D well permit apply to the CWU 1542-26DX



Notification Requirements:
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the
following actions during drilling of this well:
   • Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well  contact Carol Daniels at
801-538-5284
     (please leave a voicemail message if not available)
     OR
     submit an electronic sundry notice (pre-registration required) via the Utah Oil & Gas
website
     at http://oilgas.ogm.utah.gov

Reporting Requirements:
All reports,  forms and submittals as required by the Utah Oil  and Gas Conservation
General Rules will be promptly filed with the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining,
including but not l imited to:
   • Entity Action Form (Form 6)  due within 5 days of spudding the well
   • Monthly Status Report (Form 9)  due by 5th day of the following calendar month
   • Requests to Change Plans (Form 9)  due prior to implementation
   • Written Notice of Emergency Changes (Form 9)  due within 5 days
   • Notice of Operations Suspension or Resumption (Form 9)  due prior to
implementation
   • Report of Water Encountered (Form 7)  due within 30 days after completion
   • Well Completion Report (Form 8)  due within 30 days after completion or plugging

Approved By:

For John Rogers
Associate Director, Oil & Gas 

API Well No: 43047523950000



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0449 FNL 0471 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

2 /11 /2012

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The referenced well was spud on 2/11/2012.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3 /7 /2012

March 07, 2012

Sundry Number: 23754 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 23754 API Well Number: 43047523950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0449 FNL 0471 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

2 /1 1/2 0 12 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was spud on 2/11/2012. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
March 07, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/7/2012

RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0449 FNL 0471 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

3 /7 /2012

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 No activity has occurred since spud on 2/11/2012.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3 /7 /2012

March 07, 2012

Sundry Number: 23756 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 23756 API Well Number: 43047523950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0449 FNL 0471 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

3/7/2012
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

No activity has occurred since spud on 2/11/2012. Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
March 07, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/7/2012

RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0449 FNL 0471 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

2 /11 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests authorization for the disposal
of produced water at the following locations: NBU 20-20B SWD, CWU

550-30N SWD & CWU 2-29 SWD ROW# UTU85038, Red Wash
Evaporation Ponds 1,2,3,4,5,6&7, White River Evaporation Ponds 1&2,
Hoss SWD Wells ROW# UTU86010 & UTU897093 and Coyote 1-16 SWD

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3 /7 /2012

March 12, 2012

Sundry Number: 23755 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 23755 API Well Number: 43047523950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0449 FNL 0471 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

2/11/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests authorization for the disposal Accepted by the
of produced water at the following locations: NBU 20-20B SWD, CWU Utah Division of

550-30N SWD & CWU 2-29 SWD ROW# UTU85038, Red Wash Oil, Gas and Mining

Evaporation Ponds 1,2,3,4,5,6&7, White River Evaporation Ponds 1&2, FOR RECORD ONLY
Hoss SWD Wells ROW# UTU86010 & UTU897093 and Coyote 1-16 SWD March 12, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/7/2012

RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



BLM- Vernal Field Office - NotificationForm

Operator EOG RESOURCES Rig Name/# TRUE 34

Submitted By BILLSNAPP Phone Number877-352-0710
We11Name/Number CWU 1542-26DX

Qtr/QtrNEINE Section 96 Township as Range 22E
Lease Serial Number UTUO285A
API Number,‡3=047=5W45 V3 *W-54 ^

Spud Notice - Spud is the initial spuddingof the well,not drilling
out below a casing string.

Date/Time AM PM

Casinci- Please report timecasing run starts, not cementing
times.

Surface casing RECEIVED
Intermediate Casing MAR2 9 2012
Production Casing Div.0F0lkGAS&MINING
Liner
Other

Date/Time 03/29/2012 14:00 AM PM

BOPE
Initial BOPEtest at surface casing point
BOPEtest at intermediate casing point
30 day BOPEtest
Other

Date/Time AM PM

Remarks Approximate



BLM- Vernal Field Office - Notification Form

Operator EOG RESOURCES Rig Name/# TRUE 34
Submitted By BILLSNAPP Phone Number 877-352-0710
Well Name/Number CWU 1542-26DX
Qtr/QtrNEINE Section x Township as Range 22E
Lease Serial Number UTUO285A
API Number Ya *W-Ra W

Spud Notice - Spud is the initial spudding of the well, not drilling
out below a casing string.

Date/Time AM PM

Casing - Please report timecasing run starts, not cementing
times.

Surface Casing RECEIVED
Intermediate Casing MAR2 9 2012
Production Casing
Liner DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

Other

Date/Time 03/29/2012 14:00 AM PM

BOPE
Initial BOPEtest at surface casing point
BOPEtest at intermediate casing point
30 day BOPEtest
Other

Date/Time AM PM

Remarks Approximate



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GASANDMINING

ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator EOG Resources, Inc Operator Account Number: N 9550

Address: 600 17th Street, Suite 1000N

city Denver

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number. (435) 781-9145

Weil l

MI(Number eil Nam $ëc TWp Ang unty
43-047-52395 Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX NENE 26 9S 22E UINTAH
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number EffectiveDate
A 99999 igg6 2/11/2012 6 (

Comments: MESAVERDE

Well 2
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-50323 Chapita Wells Unit 1426-15D SWSE 15 9S 22E UINTAH
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date EntityAssignment

Number Number EffectiveData
A 99999 \ 3/9/2012 gg ( 20 R

Comments:
MESAVERDE

Well 3
AP1Number Well Name QQ See Twp Rng County
43-047-50326 Chapita Wells Unit 1428-15D SWSE 15 9S 22E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A ggggg 3/10/2012 3 [ ') 1
Comments: MESAVERDE

PML SLOSt

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) MickenzieGates
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) (Please Print)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existingentity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (Explain in'comments'sectiorlRECEIVEDRegulatory Assistant 3/29/2012

Title Dato

MAR3 0 2012
D Gas &



SUBMITASEMAIL Print Form

BLM- Vernal FieldOffice - NotificationForm

Operator EOG RESOURCES Rig Name/# TRUE 34
Submitted ByJOHNNY TURNER Phone Number877-352-0710
Well Name/Number CWU 1542-26DX
Qtr/QtrNEINE Section 6 Township 9S Range 22E
Lease Serial Number UTUO285A
API Number 43-047-52395

Spud Notice -- Spud is the initialspuddingof the well, not drilling
out below a casing string.

Date/Time AM PM

Casinq - Please report timecasing run starts, not cementing
times.

Surface casing RECEIVED
Intermediate Casing APR08 2012
Production Casing
Liner UNNG
Other

Date/Time 5/6/2012 18:oo AM PM

BOPE
Initial BOPE test at surface casing point
BOPEtest at intermediate casing point
30 day BOPEtest
Other

Date/Time AM PM

Remarks Approximate



SUBMITASEMAIL Print Form

BLM- Vernal FieldOffice - NotificationForm

Operator EOG RESOURCES Rig Name/# TRUE 34
Submitted ByJOHNNY TURNER Phone Number877-352-0710
Well Name/Number CWU 1542-26DX
Qtr/QtrNEINE Section 6 Township 9S Range 22E
Lease Serial Number UTUO285A
API Number 43-047-52395

Spud Notice -- Spud is the initialspuddingof the well, not drilling
out below a casing string.

Date/Time AM PM

Casinq - Please report timecasing run starts, not cementing
times.

Surface casing RECEIVED
Intermediate Casing APR08 2012
Production Casing
Liner UNNG
Other

Date/Time 5/6/2012 18:oo AM PM

BOPE
Initial BOPE test at surface casing point
BOPEtest at intermediate casing point
30 day BOPEtest
Other

Date/Time AM PM

Remarks Approximate



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0449 FNL 0471 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

4 /25 /2012

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The referenced well reached TD on 4-5-12, waiting on completion
operations. Please see the attached well chronology.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4 /25 /2012

May 02, 2012

Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0449 FNL 0471 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

4/25/2012
WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well reached TD on 4-5-12, waiting on completion Accepted by the
operations. Please see the attached well chronology. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
May 02, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/25/2012

RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334




ELEVATION: 5014.8’ NAT GL, 5015.3’ PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL IS 5015’), 5034’ KB
(19’)


NOTE:  MULTI PAD CWU 1541−26D, CWU 1542−26DX, CWU 1543−26D, CWU 1544−26D, CWU 1545−
26D, CWU 1546−26D





EOG WI 100%, NRI 82.139316%

02−12−2012 Reported By GERALD L ASHCRAFT

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $36,750 Completion $0 Well Total $36,750

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 60 CRAIG’S BUCKET RIG SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 2/11/12 @ 09:00 AM, SET 60’ OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX.





BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 2/10/12 @ 09:22 AM.

03−28−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $75,658 Completion $0 Daily Total $75,658

Cum Costs: Drilling $112,408 Completion $0 Well Total $112,408

MD 213 TVD 213 Progress 154 Days 1 MW 9.0 Visc 27.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 213’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 0 0 SKID SUB BACK 20’ TO CWU 1542−26DX. MOVE PUMPS AND PITS BACK 10’.

10:30 16:00 5.5 0 0 RIG UP ROTARY TOOLS.

16:00 21:00 5.0 0 0 NU RISER ON CONDUCTOR PIPE. RIG ACCEPTED ON DAYWORK @ 16:00 HRS. 3/27/2012.





21:00 22:30 1.5 0 0 LOAD RACK, STRAP AND CALIPER BHA.

22:30 23:00 0.5 0 59 PU MOTOR, BIT AND TAG BOTTOM @ 59’.

23:00 01:00 2.0 59 164 DRILLING F/59’ TO 164’.

01:00 02:00 1.0 164 164 LAY DOWN 8" DC’S.

02:00 04:00 2.0 164 164 PU MWD TOOLS & SCRIBE.

04:00 06:00 2.0 164 213 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 164’ TO 213’ = 49’, ROP 24.5 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 120 RPM.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: RIGGING UP, PICKING UP TOOLS.


FUEL: 6498 GALS., USED 228 GALS

06:00 0 0 SPUD SURFACE HOLE AT 23:00 HRS, 3/27/12.

03−29−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,439 Completion $0 Daily Total $36,439
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Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

ELEVATION: 5014.8' NAT GL, 5015.3' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL IS 5015'), 5034' KB
(19') T

NOTE: MULTI PAD CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26DX, CWU 1543-26D, CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-

26D, CWU 1546-26DI

EOG WI 100%, NRI 82.139316%

02-12-2012 Reported By GERALD L ASHCRAFT

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $36,750 Completion $0 Well Total $36,750

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 60 CRAIG'S BUCKET RIG SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 2/11/12 @09:00 AM, SET 60' OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX.1

BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 2/10/12 @09:22 AM.

03-28-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $75,658 Completion $0 Daily Total $75,658

Cum Costs: Drilling $112,408 Completion $0 Well Total $112,408

MD 213 TVD 213 Progress 154 Days 1 MW 9.0 Visc 27.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @213'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 0 0 SKID SUB BACK 20' TO CWU 1542-26DX. MOVE PUMPS AND PITS BACK 10'.

10:30 16:00 5.5 0 0 RIG UP ROTARY TOOLS.

16:00 21:00 5.0 0 0 NU RISER ON CONDUCTOR PIPE. RIG ACCEPTED ON DAYWORK @16:00 HRS. 3/27/2012.1

21:00 22:30 1.5 0 0 LOAD RACK, STRAP AND CALIPER BHA.

22:30 23:00 0.5 0 59 PU MOTOR, BIT AND TAG BOTTOM @59'.

23:00 01:00 2.0 59 164 DRILLING F/59' TO 164'.

01:00 02:00 1.0 164 164 LAY DOWN 8" DC'S.

02:00 04:00 2.0 164 164 PU MWD TOOLS & SCRIBE.

04:00 06:00 2.0 164 213 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 164' TO 213' = 49', ROP 24.5 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 120 RPM.

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: RIGGING UP, PICKING UP TOOLS.I

FUEL: 6498 GALS., USED 228 GALS

06:00 0 0 SPUD SURFACE HOLE AT 23:00 HRS, 3/27/12.

03-29-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,439 Completion $0 Daily Total $36,439
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

Cum Costs: Drilling $148,847 Completion $0 Well Total $148,847

MD 2,035 TVD 1,936 Progress 1,822 Days 2 MW 9.2 Visc 28.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 2035’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 213 641 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 213’ TO 641’ = 428’, ROP 61 FPH,WOB 5−15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 1050
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 726 GPM, 62% ROTATE, 38% SLIDE.

13:00 13:30 0.5 641 641 SERVICE RIG.

13:30 06:00 16.5 641 2035 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 641’ TO 2035’ = 1394’, ROP 84.5 FPH,WOB 5−15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 1950
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 726 GPM, 65% ROTATE, 35% SLIDE. GREEN RIVER @ 1528’, BIRDSNEST @
1760’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING:  PICKING UP TOOLS., DRLG. SURFACE.


FUEL: 5016 GALS., USED 1482 GALS

03−30−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $103,592 Completion $0 Daily Total $103,592

Cum Costs: Drilling $252,439 Completion $0 Well Total $252,439

MD 2,283 TVD 2,229 Progress 248 Days 3 MW 9.2 Visc 27.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PUMP TOP OUT CEMENT JOB

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 2035 2283 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 2035’ TO 2283’ = 248’, ROP 55 FPH,WOB 5−15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 1950
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 726 GPM, 65% ROTATE, 35% SLIDE.

10:30 11:30 1.0 2283 2283 CIRCULATE FOR TOOH TO LD DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

11:30 14:30 3.0 2283 2283 TOOH, W/PIPE SPINNERS AND LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

14:30 17:30 3.0 2283 2283 PU TRI CONE BIT, ROLLER REAMER AND TIH. 

17:30 19:00 1.5 2283 2283 CIRCULATE AND ROTATE TO CLEAN HOLE FOR CASING. SPOT 50 BBL. 11.7 PPG. MUD ON
BOTTOM.

19:00 21:00 2.0 2283 2283 TRIP OUT FOR 9 5/8" CASING, LD 8" BHA  AND 9 STANDS DP. 





21:00 02:30 5.5 2283 2283 PJSM W/WEATHERFORD,RUN 55 JTS (2276.67’) OF 9−5/8", 36.0#, K−55, ST&C CASING WITH
HALLIBURTON FLOAT SHOE AND FLOAT COLLAR. 12 CENTRALIZERS SPACED 10’ FROM THE
SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2 AND #3 THEN EVERY 5TH COLLAR TO SURFACE. ALSO 2
CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @ 2222.71’ TVD / 2273.67’ MD. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM,
INCLUDING 10’ OF RATHOLE W/TAG JOINT. NO RETURNS WHEN CIRCULATING AT CASING
POINT. PREASURE BUILT TO 120 PSI, THEN DROPPED TO 35 PSI. NO RETURNS. PUMPED 200
BBL. TO CLEAR FLOATS.
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Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

Cum Costs: Drilling $148,847 Completion $0 Well Total $148,847

MD 2,035 TVD 1,936 Progress 1,822 Days 2 MW 9.2 Visc 28.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @2035'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 213 641 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 213' TO 641' = 428', ROP 61 FPH,WOB 5-15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 1050
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 726 GPM, 62% ROTATE, 38% SLIDE.

13:00 13:30 0.5 641 641 SERVICE RIG.

13:30 06:00 16.5 641 2035 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 641' TO 2035' = 1394', ROP 84.5 FPH,WOB 5-15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 1950
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 726 GPM, 65% ROTATE, 35% SLIDE. GREEN RIVER @1528', BIRDSNEST @
1760'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: PICKING UP TOOLS., DRLG. SURFACE.1

FUEL: 5016 GALS., USED 1482 GALS

03-30-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $103,592 Completion $0 Daily Total $103,592

Cum Costs: Drilling $252,439 Completion $0 Well Total $252,439

MD 2,283 TVD 2,229 Progress 248 Days 3 MW 9.2 Visc 27.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PUMP TOP OUT CEMENT JOB

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 2035 2283 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 2035' TO 2283' = 248', ROP 55 FPH,WOB 5-15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 1950
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 726 GPM, 65% ROTATE, 35% SLIDE.

10:30 11:30 1.0 2283 2283 CIRCULATE FOR TOOH TO LD DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

11:30 14:30 3.0 2283 2283 TOOH, W/PIPE SPINNERS AND LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

14:30 17:30 3.0 2283 2283 PU TRI CONE BIT, ROLLER REAMER AND TIH.

17:30 19:00 1.5 2283 2283 CIRCULATE AND ROTATE TO CLEAN HOLE FOR CASING. SPOT 50 BBL. 11.7 PPG. MUD ON
BOTTOM.

19:00 21:00 2.0 2283 2283 TRIP OUT FOR 9 5/8" CASING, LD 8" BHA AND 9 STANDS DP.
-

21:00 02:30 5.5 2283 2283 PJSM W/WEATHERFORD,RUN 55 JTS (2276.67') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#, K-55, ST&C CASING WITH
HALLIBURTON FLOAT SHOE AND FLOAT COLLAR. 12 CENTRALIZERS SPACED 10'FROM THE
SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2 AND #3 THEN EVERY 5TH COLLAR TO SURFACE. ALSO 2
CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @2222.71' TVD / 2273.67' MD. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM,
INCLUDING 10' OF RATHOLE W/TAG JOINT. NO RETURNS WHEN CIRCULATING AT CASING
POINT. PREASURE BUILT TO 120 PSI, THEN DROPPED TO 35 PSI. NO RETURNS. PUMPED 200
BBL. TO CLEAR

FLOATS.¯
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

02:30 06:00 3.5 2283 2283 PJSM W/HALLIBURTON, TEST LINES TO 5000 PSI. PUMPED 20 BBLS GEL/ WATER FLUSH AHEAD
OF CEMENT. LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (182 BBLS) OF HES VARICEM LEAD
CEMENT WITH 0.3% VERSASET, 2% CAL−SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @
10.5 PPG WITH YIELD OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63 BBLS) OF HES
HALCEM CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2 MIXED @ 15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.18 CF/SX. WASHED UP
ON PLUG. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH 172 BBLS FRESH WATER. FINAL PSI 450, BUMPED PLUG
WITH 500 PSI. OVER @ 04:40 AM ON 03/30/12. FLOATS HELD. REGAINED RETURNS @ 134 BBL
DISPLACEMENT AWAY (DLRG FLUID). NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. CALCULATED FINAL PSI=539
PSI. RUNNING 200’ OF 1" PIPE FOR TOP OUTSIDE JOB #1 AT REPORT TIME. DETAILS TO FOLLOW. 





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING:  TRIPPING., RUNNING CASING.


FUEL: 4104 GALS., USED 912 GALS


BILL SNAPP NOTIFIED BLM/VERNAL AND CAROL DANIELS/UDOGM/SALT LAKE OF UPCOMING
SURFACE CASING JOB. @ 14:00 HRS. 3/29/12 VIA E−MAILED BLM FORM AT 21:00 HRS. 03/28/12.

03−31−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $61,974 Completion $0 Daily Total $61,974

Cum Costs: Drilling $314,414 Completion $0 Well Total $314,414

MD 2,365 TVD 2,318 Progress 82 Days 4 MW 10.4 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DLILLING @ 2365’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 2283 2283 TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 60’ OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15.4 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL.

07:00 09:00 2.0 2283 2283 WAIT ON CEMENT.

09:00 13:00 4.0 2283 2283 CUT OFF AND WELD ON HEAD, GOOD CEMENT STILL @ SURFACE.

13:00 17:00 4.0 2283 2283 NU BOP.

17:00 22:00 5.0 2283 2283 TEST UPPER & LOWER  KELLY VALVES, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE VALVES, CHOKE MANIFOLD,
CHECK VALVE, PIPE RAMS & BLIND RAMS TO 5000 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, ANNULAR 2500 PSI
HIGH, 250 LOW.

22:00 22:30 0.5 2283 2283 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.

22:30 23:30 1.0 2283 2283 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND BHA.

23:30 01:30 2.0 2283 2283 TRIP IN HOLE.

01:30 02:30 1.0 2283 2283 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

02:30 03:00 0.5 2283 2283 TIH, TAG CEMENT @ 2216’.

03:00 04:00 1.0 2283 2283 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP.

04:00 04:30 0.5 2283 2293 DRILLED 10’ OF NEW HOLE TO 2293’.

04:30 05:00 0.5 2293 2293 FIT TO 203 PSI W10.3 PPG MUD WT.= 12 PPG EQUIVILANT MW.

05:00 06:00 1.0 2293 2365 ROTATE & SLIDE 2293’ TO 2365’= 72’, ROP 72 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 1650 PSI,
DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE@ 2325’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING:  TEST BOP, DRLG OUT CEMENT..
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Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

02:30 06:00 3.5 2283 2283 PJSM W/HALLIBURTON, TEST LINES TO 5000 PSI. PUMPED 20 BBLS GEL/ WATER FLUSH AHEAD
OF CEMENT. LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (182 BBLS) OF HES VARICEM LEAD
CEMENT WITH 0.3% VERSASET, 2% CAL-SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @
10.5 PPG WITH YIELD OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63 BBLS) OF HES
HALCEM CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2 MIXED @15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.18 CF/SX. WASHED UP
ON PLUG. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH 172 BBLS FRESH WATER. FINAL PSI 450, BUMPED PLUG
WITH 500 PSI. OVER @04:40 AM ON 03/30/12. FLOATS HELD. REGAINED RETURNS @134 BBL
DISPLACEMENT AWAY (DLRG FLUID). NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. CALCULATED FINAL PSI=539

PSI. RUNNING 200' OF 1" PIPE FOR TOP OUTSIDE JOB #1 AT REPORT TIME. DETAILS TO FOLLOW.

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: TRIPPING., RUNNING CASING.1

FUEL: 4104 GALS., USED 912 GALSI

BILL SNAPP NOTIFIED BLM/VERNAL AND CAROL DANIELS/UDOGM/SALT LAKE OF UPCOMING
SURFACE CASING JOB. @14:00 HRS. 3/29/12 VIA E-MAILED BLM FORM AT 21:00 HRS. 03/28/12.

03-31-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $61,974 Completion $0 Daily Total $61,974

Cum Costs: Drilling $314,414 Completion $0 Well Total $314,414

MD 2,365 TVD 2,318 Progress 82 Days 4 MW 10.4 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DLILLING @2365'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 2283 2283 TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 60' OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15.4 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL.

07:00 09:00 2.0 2283 2283 WAIT ON CEMENT.

09:00 13:00 4.0 2283 2283 CUT OFF AND WELD ON HEAD, GOOD CEMENT STILL @SURFACE.

13:00 17:00 4.0 2283 2283 NU BOP.

17:00 22:00 5.0 2283 2283 TEST UPPER & LOWER KELLY VALVES, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE VALVES, CHOKE MANIFOLD,
CHECK VALVE, PIPE RAMS & BLIND RAMS TO 5000 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, ANNULAR 2500 PSI
HIGH, 250 LOW.

22:00 22:30 0.5 2283 2283 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.

22:30 23:30 1.0 2283 2283 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND BHA.

23:30 01:30 2.0 2283 2283 TRIP IN HOLE.

01:30 02:30 1.0 2283 2283 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

02:30 03:00 0.5 2283 2283 TIH, TAG CEMENT @2216'.

03:00 04:00 1.0 2283 2283 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP.

04:00 04:30 0.5 2283 2293 DRILLED 10' OF NEW HOLE TO 2293'.

04:30 05:00 0.5 2293 2293 FIT TO 203 PSI W10.3 PPG MUD WT.= 12 PPG EQUIVILANT MW.

05:00 06:00 1.0 2293 2365 ROTATE & SLIDE 2293' TO 2365'= 72', ROP 72 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 1650 PSI,
DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE@ 2325'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: TEST BOP, DRLG OUT CEMENT..I
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

FUEL: 3762 GALS., USED 342 GALS

04−01−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $96,719 Completion $0 Daily Total $96,719

Cum Costs: Drilling $411,133 Completion $0 Well Total $411,133

MD 4,485 TVD 4,425 Progress 2,120 Days 5 MW 10.3 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 4485’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 2365 3081 ROTATE & SLIDE 2365’ TO 3081’= 716’, ROP 102 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 1650
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 92.5% ROTATE, 7.5% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE@ 2325’.

13:00 13:30 0.5 3081 3081 SERVICE RIG.

13:30 06:00 16.5 3081 4485 ROTATE & SLIDE 3081’ TO 4485’= 1404’, ROP 85 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 92.4% ROTATE, 7.6% SLIDE.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: HOUSE KEEPING, WORKING W/ELECTRICITY.


FUEL: 6840 GALS., USED 1422 GALS  RCVD−4500 GAL.

04−02−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,241 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,241

Cum Costs: Drilling $446,374 Completion $0 Well Total $446,374

MD 6,085 TVD 6,025 Progress 1,600 Days 6 MW 10.5 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 6085’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 4485 5171 ROTATE & SLIDE 4485’ TO 5171’= 686’, ROP 76 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 2150 PSI,
DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 97.8 ROTATE, 2.2% SLIDE. WASATCH@ 4681’.

15:00 15:30 0.5 5171 5171 SERVICE RIG.

15:30 06:00 14.5 5171 6085 ROTATE & SLIDE 5171’ TO 6085’= 914’, ROP 63 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 2350 PSI,
DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 97.7% ROTATE, 2.3% SLIDE. CHAPITA WELLS@ 5271’, BUCK CANYON@
5870’. LOST 60 BBL MUD@ 5367’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: HORSE PLAY, DRIVING TO/FROM WORK.


FUEL: 5130 GALS., USED 1710 GALS.

04−03−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $50,355 Completion $0 Daily Total $50,355

Cum Costs: Drilling $496,730 Completion $0 Well Total $496,730

MD 7,065 TVD 7,005 Progress 980 Days 7 MW 11.0 Visc 35.0
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Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

FUEL: 3762 GALS., USED 342 GALS

04-01-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $96,719 Completion $0 Daily Total $96,719

Cum Costs: Drilling $411,133 Completion $0 Well Total $411,133

MD 4,485 TVD 4,425 Progress 2,120 Days 5 MW 10.3 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @4485'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 2365 3081 ROTATE & SLIDE 2365' TO 3081'= 716', ROP 102 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 1650
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 92.5% ROTATE, 7.5% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE@ 2325'.

13:00 13:30 0.5 3081 3081 SERVICE RIG.

13:30 06:00 16.5 3081 4485 ROTATE & SLIDE 3081' TO 4485'= 1404', ROP 85 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 92.4% ROTATE, 7.6% SLIDE.1

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS I

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSE KEEPING, WORKING W/ELECTRICITY.1

FUEL: 6840 GALS., USED 1422 GALS RCVD-4500 GAL.

04-02-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,241 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,241

Cum Costs: Drilling $446,374 Completion $0 Well Total $446,374

MD 6,085 TVD 6,025 Progress 1,600 Days 6 MW 10.5 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @6085'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 4485 5171 ROTATE & SLIDE 4485' TO 5171'= 686', ROP 76 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 2150 PSI,
DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 97.8 ROTATE, 2.2% SLIDE. WASATCH@ 4681'.

15:00 15:30 0.5 5171 5171 SERVICE RIG.

15:30 06:00 14.5 5171 6085 ROTATE & SLIDE 5171' TO 6085'= 914', ROP 63 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 2350 PSI,
DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 97.7% ROTATE, 2.3% SLIDE. CHAPITA WELLS@ 5271', BUCK CANYON@
5870'. LOST 60 BBL MUD@ 5367'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS I

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: HORSE PLAY, DRIVING TO/FROM WORK.1

FUEL: 5130 GALS., USED 1710 GALS.

04-03-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $50,355 Completion $0 Daily Total $50,355

Cum Costs: Drilling $496,730 Completion $0 Well Total $496,730

MD 7,065 TVD 7,005 Progress 980 Days 7 MW 11.0 Visc 35.0
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 7065’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 6085 6519 ROTATE & SLIDE 6085’ TO 6519’= 434’, ROP 45.7 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 96.5% ROTATE, 3.5% SLIDE. 

15:30 16:00 0.5 6519 6519 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 6519 7065 ROTATE & SLIDE 6519’ TO 7065’= 546’, ROP 39 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 70,  SPP 2390 PSI,
DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE. NORTH HORN@ 6642’, PRICE RIVER TOP@
6997’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: KEEPING AIR PSI TO RIG, INSPECTING PPE.


FUEL: 3420 GALS., USED 1710 GALS.

04−04−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $65,681 Completion $6,668 Daily Total $72,349

Cum Costs: Drilling $562,411 Completion $6,668 Well Total $569,079

MD 8,000 TVD 7,940 Progress 935 Days 8 MW 11.2 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 8000’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 7065 7358 ROTATE & SLIDE 7065’ TO 7358’= 293’, ROP 30.8 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 70,  SPP 2390
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE. 

15:30 16:00 0.5 7358 7358 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 7358 8000 ROTATE & SLIDE 7358’ TO 8000’= 642’, ROP 45.8 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 67,  SPP 2500
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE@ 7869’. LOST 110
BBL. MUD@ 7260’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: WORKING W/POWER CORDS, FORKLIFT OPERATION.


FUEL: 5814 GALS., USED 1806 GALS. RCVD 4200 GAL.

04−05−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER/BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $43,173 Completion $0 Daily Total $43,173

Cum Costs: Drilling $605,584 Completion $6,668 Well Total $612,252

MD 8,940 TVD 8,873 Progress 940 Days 9 MW 11.5 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 8940’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @7065'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 6085 6519 ROTATE & SLIDE 6085' TO 6519'= 434', ROP 45.7 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 96.5% ROTATE, 3.5% SLIDE.

15:30 16:00 0.5 6519 6519 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 6519 7065 ROTATE & SLIDE 6519' TO 7065'= 546', ROP 39 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 70, SPP 2390 PSI,
DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE. NORTH HORN@ 6642', PRICE RIVER TOP@
6997'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS I

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: KEEPING AIR PSI TO RIG, INSPECTING PPE.1

FUEL: 3420 GALS., USED 1710 GALS.

04-04-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $65,681 Completion $6,668 Daily Total $72,349

Cum Costs: Drilling $562,411 Completion $6,668 Well Total $569,079

MD 8,000 TVD 7,940 Progress 935 Days 8 MW 11.2 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @8000'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 7065 7358 ROTATE & SLIDE 7065' TO 7358'= 293', ROP 30.8 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 70, SPP 2390
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE.

15:30 16:00 0.5 7358 7358 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 7358 8000 ROTATE & SLIDE 7358' TO 8000'= 642', ROP 45.8 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 67, SPP 2500
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE@ 7869'. LOST 110
BBL. MUD@ 7260'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS I

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: WORKING W/POWER CORDS, FORKLIFT OPERATION.1

FUEL: 5814 GALS., USED 1806 GALS. RCVD 4200 GAL.

04-05-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER/BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $43,173 Completion $0 Daily Total $43,173

Cum Costs: Drilling $605,584 Completion $6,668 Well Total $612,252

MD 8,940 TVD 8,873 Progress 940 Days 9 MW 11.5 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @8940'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 12:30 6.5 8000 8262 ROTATE & SLIDE 8000’ TO 8262’’= 262’, ROP 40.3 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 63,  SPP 2225
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 418 GPM. 95% ROTATE, 5% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7869’, PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8658’.

12:30 13:00 0.5 8262 8262 SERVICE RIG.

13:00 06:00 17.0 8262 8940 ROTATE & SLIDE 8262’ TO 8940’= 678’, ROP 39.9 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 63,  SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 418 GPM. 95.5% ROTATE, 4.5% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE@ 7869’, PRICE
RIVER 8658, SEGO 9164’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: WORKING W/ 3RD PERSONAL, PROPER CLOTHING


FUEL: 4332 GAL., USED 1482 GALS.

04−06−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,945 Completion $0 Daily Total $39,945

Cum Costs: Drilling $645,530 Completion $6,668 Well Total $652,198

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 435 Days 10 MW 11.8 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TIH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 8940 9293 ROTATE & SLIDE 8940’ TO 9293’= 353’, ROP 39.2 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 60,  SPP 2400
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 400 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 8658, SEGO 9164’.

15:00 15:30 0.5 9293 9293 SERVICE RIG.

15:30 18:30 3.0 9293 9375 ROTATE & SLIDE 9293’ TO 9375’= 82’, ROP 27.3 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 60,  SPP 2400
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 400 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, SEGO 9164’. REACHED TD AT @ 18:30 HRS,
4/5/2012.





18:30 21:30 3.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, CHECK FLOW.

21:30 04:30 7.0 9375 9375 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR WIPER TRIP. WORK TIGHT HOLE 7240’ TO 7200’, 5240’ TO 5220’, 4660’ TO
4550’.

04:30 05:30 1.0 9375 9375 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

05:30 06:00 0.5 9375 9375 MAKE UP BIT SUB & BIT & TRIP IN HOLE.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, USING MAN BASKET, WORKING IN HIGH WINDS


COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPING


FUEL 2850 GALS., USED 1482 GALS.

04−07−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,991 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,991

Cum Costs: Drilling $687,521 Completion $6,668 Well Total $694,189

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 12.1 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN 4.5" CASING

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 12:30 6.5 8000 8262 ROTATE & SLIDE 8000' TO 8262"= 262', ROP 40.3 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 63, SPP 2225
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 418 GPM. 95% ROTATE, 5% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7869', PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8658'.

12:30 13:00 0.5 8262 8262 SERVICE RIG.

13:00 06:00 17.0 8262 8940 ROTATE & SLIDE 8262' TO 8940'= 678', ROP 39.9 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 63, SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 418 GPM. 95.5% ROTATE, 4.5% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE@ 7869', PRICE
RIVER 8658, SEGO 9164'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS I

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: WORKING W/ 3RD PERSONAL, PROPER CLOTHINGT

FUEL: 4332 GAL., USED 1482 GALS.

04-06-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,945 Completion $0 Daily Total $39,945

Cum Costs: Drilling $645,530 Completion $6,668 Well Total $652,198

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 435 Days 10 MW 11.8 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TIH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 8940 9293 ROTATE & SLIDE 8940' TO 9293'= 353', ROP 39.2 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 60, SPP 2400
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 400 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 8658, SEGO 9164'.

15:00 15:30 0.5 9293 9293 SERVICE RIG.

15:30 18:30 3.0 9293 9375 ROTATE & SLIDE 9293' TO 9375'= 82', ROP 27.3 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 60, SPP 2400
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 400 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, SEGO 9164'. REACHED TD AT @18:30 HRS,
4/5/2012.1

18:30 21:30 3.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, CHECK FLOW.

21:30 04:30 7.0 9375 9375 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR WIPER TRIP. WORK TIGHT HOLE 7240' TO 7200', 5240' TO 5220', 4660' TO
4550'.

04:30 05:30 1.0 9375 9375 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

05:30 06:00 0.5 9375 9375 MAKE UP BIT SUB & BIT & TRIP IN HOLE.1

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, USING MAN BASKET, WORKING IN HIGH WINDS I

COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPINGT

FUEL 2850 GALS., USED 1482 GALS.

04-07-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,991 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,991

Cum Costs: Drilling $687,521 Completion $6,668 Well Total $694,189

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 12.1 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN 4.5" CASING

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 08:00 2.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE, TAG BRIDGE @ 4612’.

08:00 09:00 1.0 9375 9375 PICK UP KELLY & WASH THRU BRIDGE

09:00 10:00 1.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE, TAG BRIDGE @ 7024’.

10:00 11:30 1.5 9375 9375 PICK UP KELLY & WASH THRU BRIDGE, LOST 150 BBLS OF MUD.

11:30 13:00 1.5 9375 9375 CIRCULATE, & BUILD VOLUME.

13:00 14:00 1.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE.

14:00 14:30 0.5 9375 9375 WASH/REAM 100’ TO BOTTOM, 8’ OF FILL.

14:30 16:30 2.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE & CONDITION HOLE ON BOTTOM.10’ TO 15’ FLARE  FOR 30MIN.

16:30 21:30 5.0 9375 9375 HOLD PJSM W/ FRANKS & LAY DOWN DRILLPIPE.

21:30 22:00 0.5 9375 9375 BREAK KELLY, PULL DRIVE BUSHING & ROTATING RUBBER.

22:00 23:00 1.0 9375 9375 LAY DOWN BHA.

23:00 23:30 0.5 9375 9375 PULL WEAR BUSHING.

23:30 06:00 6.5 9375 9375 HOLD PJSM W/ FRANKS, RIG UP CASERS & RUN 4.5" CASING. CASING DETAILS TO FOLLOW ON
TOMORROWS REPORT.  SHOE AT 6100’ AT REPORT TIME.  





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, LAYING DOWN D.P., RUNNING CASING


COM CHECK TRIPPING


FUEL, 2166 GALS., USED 684 GALS.

04−08−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,133 Completion $169,222 Daily Total $205,356

Cum Costs: Drilling $723,654 Completion $175,890 Well Total $899,545

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 12.0 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 08:30 2.5 9375 9375 RUN TOTAL OF 226 JTS OF CASING ( 224 FULL JTS  OF 4.5", 11.6#, N−80, LT&C + 2 MARKER
JOINTS 11.6#, P−110, LT&C) AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, 56 JTS OF
CASING, MARKER JOINT, @ TOP OF PRICE RIVER, 65 JTS, CASING, MARKER JOINT, @ 400’
ABOVE WASATCH, 102 JTS CASING. RAN 3 TURBILIZERS (5’ ABOVE SHOE AND MIDDLE OF JTS
#2 & #3) + 1 BOW CENTRALIZER EVERY 3RD JOINT THEREAFTER TO 400’ ABOVE WASATCH
(TOTAL OF 40) TAG BOTTOM , LAY DOWN TAG JOINT, PICK UP MANDREL & LAND CASING W/
80K STRING WEIGHT @ 9375’. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM W/ NO HOLE PROBLEMS.





CASING LANDED AS FOLLOWS (DEPTHS SHOWN ARE TOPS OF 


COMPONENTS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED):


FLOAT SHOE (BOTTOM): 9369’


FLOAT COLLAR: 9325’


MARKER JOINT: 6986’


MARKER JOINT: 4270’





08:30 11:30 3.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE CASING ON BOTTOM, LAST 200 BBLS W/ 0.5 GPT ALDICIDE. NO FLARE. 
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Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 08:00 2.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE, TAG BRIDGE @4612'.

08:00 09:00 1.0 9375 9375 PICK UP KELLY & WASH THRU BRIDGE

09:00 10:00 1.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE, TAG BRIDGE @7024'.

10:00 11:30 1.5 9375 9375 PICK UP KELLY & WASH THRU BRIDGE, LOST 150 BBLS OF MUD.

11:30 13:00 1.5 9375 9375 CIRCULATE, & BUILD VOLUME.

13:00 14:00 1.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE.

14:00 14:30 0.5 9375 9375 WASH/REAM 100' TO BOTTOM, 8' OF FILL.

14:30 16:30 2.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE & CONDITION HOLE ON BOTTOM.10' TO 15'FLARE FOR 30MIN.

16:30 21:30 5.0 9375 9375 HOLD PJSM W/ FRANKS & LAY DOWN DRILLPIPE.

21:30 22:00 0.5 9375 9375 BREAK KELLY, PULL DRIVE BUSHING & ROTATING RUBBER.

22:00 23:00 1.0 9375 9375 LAY DOWN BHA.

23:00 23:30 0.5 9375 9375 PULL WEAR BUSHING.

23:30 06:00 6.5 9375 9375 HOLD PJSM W/ FRANKS, RIG UP CASERS & RUN 4.5" CASING. CASING DETAILS TO FOLLOW ON
TOMORROWS REPORT. SHOE AT 6100' AT REPORT TIME. I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, LAYING DOWN D.P., RUNNING CASINGT

COM CHECK TRIPPINGT

FUEL, 2166 GALS., USED 684 GALS.

04-08-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,133 Completion $169,222 Daily Total $205,356

Cum Costs: Drilling $723,654 Completion $175,890 Well Total $899,545

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 12.0 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 08:30 2.5 9375 9375 RUN TOTAL OF 226 JTS OF CASING ( 224 FULL JTS OF 4.5", 11.6#, N-80, LT&C + 2 MARKER
JOINTS 11.6#, P-110, LT&C) AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, 56 JTS OF
CASING, MARKER JOINT, @TOP OF PRICE RIVER, 65 JTS, CASING, MARKER JOINT, @400'
ABOVE WASATCH, 102 JTS CASING. RAN 3 TURBILIZERS (5'ABOVE SHOE AND MIDDLE OF JTS
#2 & #3) + 1 BOW CENTRALIZER EVERY 3RD JOINT THEREAFTER TO 400'ABOVE WASATCH
(TOTAL OF 40) TAG BOTTOM , LAY DOWN TAG JOINT, PICK UP MANDREL & LAND CASING W/
80K STRING WEIGHT @9375'. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM W/ NO HOLE PROBLEMS.I

CASING LANDED AS FOLLOWS (DEPTHS SHOWN ARE TOPS OF I

COMPONENTS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED):I

FLOAT SHOE (BOTTOM): 9369'l

FLOAT COLLAR: 9325'l

MARKER JOINT: 6986'l

MARKER JOINT: 4270'l

08:30 11:30 3.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE CASING ON BOTTOM, LAST 200 BBLS W/ 0.5 GPT ALDICIDE. NO FLARE.
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

11:30 14:00 2.5 9375 9375 TEST LINE TO 5000#, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH WATER
W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 510 SKS (144 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61 YIELD W/ 4% BENTONITE, 0.3%
VERSASET, 0.5% HR−5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1345 SKS (352 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47 YIELD W/ 0.125
LBM POLY−E−FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 144.5 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5 GPT
MYACIDE, DISPLACED @ 8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 3 BBLS MIN W/ 137BBLS GONE, FCP 2313#,
BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3500#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT,  FLOATS HELD. FULL
RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB.





14:00 15:00 1.0 9375 9375 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# ON CASING & HOLD FOR 1 HOUR.

15:00 16:00 1.0 9375 9375 REMOVE CEMENT HEAD, LANDING JOINT, INSTALL PACK OFF & TEST TO 5000#.

16:00 18:00 2.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN & CLEAN MUD TANKS.  RELEASE RIG @ 18:00, 4/7/2012.

18:00 06:00 12.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN, & PREPARE FOR TRUCKS.





NO INCICENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING  CEMENTING & RIGGING DOWN


FUEL 1824 GALS., USED 342 GALS.


TRANSFERED 1824 GALS TO CWU 1206−14





06:00 0 0 RELEASED RIG @ 18:00 HRS, 4/7/12.


CASING POINT COST $723,655
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Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25068 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

11:30 14:00 2.5 9375 9375 TEST LINE TO 5000#, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH WATER
W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 510 SKS (144 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61YIELD W/ 4% BENTONITE, 0.3%
VERSASET, 0.5% HR-5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1345 SKS (352 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47YIELD W/ 0.125
LBM POLY-E-FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 144.5 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5 GPT
MYACIDE, DISPLACED @8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 3 BBLS MIN W/ 137BBLS GONE, FCP 2313#,
BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3500#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT, FLOATS HELD. FULL
RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB.1

14:00 15:00 1.0 9375 9375 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# ON CASING & HOLD FOR 1 HOUR.

15:00 16:00 1.0 9375 9375 REMOVE CEMENT HEAD, LANDING JOINT, INSTALL PACK OFF & TEST TO 5000#.

16:00 18:00 2.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN & CLEAN MUD TANKS. RELEASE RIG @18:00, 4/7/2012.

18:00 06:00 12.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN, & PREPARE FOR TRUCKS.I

NO INCICENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING CEMENTING & RIGGING DOWNT

FUEL 1824 GALS., USED 342 GALS.I

TRANSFERED 1824 GALS TO CWU 1206-141

06:00 0 0 RELEASED RIG @18:00 HRS, 4/7/12.1

CASING POINT COST $723,655
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RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0449 FNL 0471 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

5 /21 /2012

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Completion operations for the referenced well began on 5-12-12.
Please see the attached well chronology. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /21 /2012

May 21, 2012

Sundry Number: 25911 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25911 API Well Number: 43047523950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0449 FNL 0471 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

5/21/2012
WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Completion operations for the referenced well began on 5-12-12.
Accepted by the

Please see the attached well chronology. Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
May 21, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/21/2012

RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

11:30 14:00 2.5 9375 9375 TEST LINE TO 5000#, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH WATER
W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 510 SKS (144 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61 YIELD W/ 4% BENTONITE, 0.3%
VERSASET, 0.5% HR−5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1345 SKS (352 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47 YIELD W/ 0.125
LBM POLY−E−FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 144.5 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5 GPT
MYACIDE, DISPLACED @ 8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 3 BBLS MIN W/ 137BBLS GONE, FCP 2313#,
BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3500#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT,  FLOATS HELD. FULL
RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB.





14:00 15:00 1.0 9375 9375 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# ON CASING & HOLD FOR 1 HOUR.

15:00 16:00 1.0 9375 9375 REMOVE CEMENT HEAD, LANDING JOINT, INSTALL PACK OFF & TEST TO 5000#.

16:00 18:00 2.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN & CLEAN MUD TANKS.  RELEASE RIG @ 18:00, 4/7/2012.

18:00 06:00 12.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN, & PREPARE FOR TRUCKS.





NO INCICENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING  CEMENTING & RIGGING DOWN


FUEL 1824 GALS., USED 342 GALS.


TRANSFERED 1824 GALS TO CWU 1206−14





06:00 0 0 RELEASED RIG @ 18:00 HRS, 4/7/12.


CASING POINT COST $752,075

04−13−2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $16,000 Daily Total $16,000

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $191,890 Well Total $956,223

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. LOG WITH CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FORM 9317’ TO 70’. EST CEMENT TOP
@ 750’. RDWL.

05−12−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $258 Daily Total $258

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $192,148 Well Total $956,481

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8963’−9129’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 FRAC TANKS PRE MIXED W/BIOCIDE (BE 6) @ 3# PER TANK.





STAGE 1. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE & MIRU HALLIBURTON, PERFORATE LPR FROM 9128’−29’,
9119’−20’, 9094’−95’, 9087’−88’, 9066’−67’, 9058’−59’, 9048’−49’, 9032’−33’, 9025’−26’, 9011’−12’,
9002’−03’, 8963’−64’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL
OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO
6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON
KW31 @ 2GPT), 618 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7660 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9900# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5
PPG, 23366 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/78800# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 6020 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM.
ATP 4420 PSIG. ATR 50 BPM. ISIP 2964 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.
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Sundry Number: 25911 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25911 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

11:30 14:00 2.5 9375 9375 TEST LINE TO 5000#, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH WATER
W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 510 SKS (144 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61YIELD W/ 4% BENTONITE, 0.3%
VERSASET, 0.5% HR-5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1345 SKS (352 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47YIELD W/ 0.125
LBM POLY-E-FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 144.5 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5 GPT
MYACIDE, DISPLACED @8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 3 BBLS MIN W/ 137BBLS GONE, FCP 2313#,
BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3500#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT, FLOATS HELD. FULL
RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB.1

14:00 15:00 1.0 9375 9375 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# ON CASING & HOLD FOR 1 HOUR.

15:00 16:00 1.0 9375 9375 REMOVE CEMENT HEAD, LANDING JOINT, INSTALL PACK OFF & TEST TO 5000#.

16:00 18:00 2.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN & CLEAN MUD TANKS. RELEASE RIG @18:00, 4/7/2012.

18:00 06:00 12.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN, & PREPARE FOR TRUCKS.I

NO INCICENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING CEMENTING & RIGGING DOWNT

FUEL 1824 GALS., USED 342 GALS.I

TRANSFERED 1824 GALS TO CWU 1206-141

06:00 0 0 RELEASED RIG @18:00 HRS, 4/7/12.1

CASING POINT COST $752,075

04-13-2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $16,000 Daily Total $16,000

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $191,890 Well Total $956,223

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. LOG WITH CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FORM 9317' TO 70'. EST CEMENT TOP

@750'. RDWL.

05-12-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $258 Daily Total $258

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $192,148 Well Total $956,481

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8963'-9129' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 FRAC TANKS PRE MIXED W/BIOCIDE (BE 6) @3# PER
TANK.¯

STAGE 1. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE & MIRU HALLIBURTON, PERFORATE LPR FROM 9128'-29',
9119'-20', 9094'-95', 9087'-88', 9066'-67', 9058'-59', 9048'-49', 9032'-33', 9025'-26', 901l'-12',
9002'-03', 8963'-64' @3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL
OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO
6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON
KW31 @2GPT), 618 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7660 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9900# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5

PPG, 23366 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/78800# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 6020 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM.
ATP 4420 PSIG. ATR 50 BPM. ISIP 2964 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

05−13−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $258 Daily Total $258

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $192,406 Well Total $956,739

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8552’−9129’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 STAGE 2. SICP 1770 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8946’. PERFORATE LPR FROM 8924’−25’,
8918’−19’, 8899’−8900’, 8890’−91’, 8882’−83’, 8856’−57’, 8828’−29’, 8814’−15’, 8799’−8800’, 8782’−83’,
8778’−79’, 8769’−70’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31
@ 2GPT). 935 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7518 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9700# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG,
4565 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/6800# 20/40 SAND @ 2−3 PPG.WENT TO FLUSH. GEL UNIT BLEW OUT
A COOLANT HOSE. OVER FLUSHED 30 BBLS.  REPAIRED GEL UNIT. 


RESUMED STAGE 2 . 1785 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 22967 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/75500# 20/40 SAND
@ 2−4 PPG.  MTP 5500 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 4324 PSIG. ATR 48.7 BPM. ISIP 3321 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 3. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8754’. PERFORATE MPR/LPR FROM 8736’−37’, 8727’−28’,
8719’−20’, 8690’−91’, 8678’−79’, 8669’−70’, 8637’−38’, 8626’−27’, 8588’−89’, 8575’−76’, 8560’−61’,
8552’−53’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC
6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106 PLUS 5
BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT),
791 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7586 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9800# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 34401 GAL
16# DELTA 200 W/111600# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5905 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 5149 PSIG.
ATR 47.4 BPM. ISIP 3629 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05−14−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $387,058 Daily Total $387,058

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $579,464 Well Total $1,343,797

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036’−9129’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU CLEAN OUT SAND AND DRILL OUT FRAC PLUGS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 0 0 STAGE 4. INTIAL PRESSUER 1799 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8548’. PERFORATE MPR FROM
8518’−19’, 8514’−15’, 8503’−04’, 8496’−97’, 8488’−89’, 8470’−71’, 8464’−65’, 8454’−55’, 8433’−34’,
8426’−27’, 8401’−02’, 8394’−95’@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD
PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55
GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL
BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 704 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7420 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500#
20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 33064 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/110500# 20/40 SAND @ 2−4 PPG. MTP 5694
PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4494 PSIG. ATR 49.3 BPM. ISIP 3077 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 5. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8378’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8358’−59’, 8342’−43’, 8329’−30’,
8320’−21’, 8308’−09’, 8287’−88’, 8278’−79’, 8262’−63’, 8254’−55’, 8245’−46’, 8221’−22’, 8208’−09’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 846
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7415 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 41383 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/143200# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5732 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4051 PSIG. ATR
49.7 BPM. ISIP 2622 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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Sundry Number: 25911 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25911 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

05-13-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $258 Daily Total $258

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $192,406 Well Total $956,739

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8552'-9129' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 STAGE 2. SICP 1770 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8946'. PERFORATE LPR FROM 8924'-25',
8918'-19', 8899'-8900', 8890'-91', 8882'-83', 8856'-57', 8828'-29', 8814'-15', 8799'-8800', 8782'-83',
8778'-79', 8769'-70' @3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31

@2GPT). 935 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7518 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9700# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG,
4565 GAL 16#DELTA 200 W/6800# 20/40 SAND @2-3 PPG.WENT TO FLUSH. GEL UNIT BLEW OUT
A COOLANT HOSE. OVER FLUSHED 30 BBLS. REPAIRED GEL UNIT.

-

RESUMED STAGE 2 . 1785 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 22967 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/75500# 20/40 SAND

@2-4 PPG. MTP 5500 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 4324 PSIG. ATR 48.7 BPM. ISIP 3321 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 3. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8754'. PERFORATE MPR/LPR FROM 8736'-37', 8727'-28',
8719'-20', 8690'-91', 8678'-79', 8669'-70', 8637'-38', 8626'-27', 8588'-89', 8575'-76', 8560'-61',
8552'-53' @3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC
6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106 PLUS 5
BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT),
791 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7586 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9800# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 34401 GAL
16# DELTA 200 W/lll600# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5905 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 5149 PSIG.
ATR 47.4 BPM. ISIP 3629 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05-14-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $387,058 Daily Total $387,058

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $579,464 Well Total $1,343,797

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036'-9129' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU CLEAN OUT SAND AND DRILL OUT FRAC PLUGS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 0 0 STAGE 4. INTIAL PRESSUER 1799 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8548'. PERFORATE MPR FROM
8518'-19', 8514'-15', 8503'-04', 8496'-97', 8488'-89', 8470'-71', 8464'-65', 8454'-55', 8433'-34',
8426'-27', 8401'-02', 8394'-95'@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD
PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55
GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL
BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 704 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7420 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500#
20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 33064 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/110500# 20/40 SAND @2-4 PPG. MTP 5694
PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4494 PSIG. ATR 49.3 BPM. ISIP 3077 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 5. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8378'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8358'-59', 8342'-43', 8329'-30',
8320'-21', 8308'-09', 8287'-88', 8278'-79', 8262'-63', 8254'-55', 8245'-46', 8221'-22', 8208'-09'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 846
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7415 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 41383 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/143200# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5732 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4051 PSIG. ATR
49.7 BPM. ISIP 2622 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

STAGE 6. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8188’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8168’−69’, 8137’−38’, 8128’−29’,
8120’−21’, 8114’−15’, 8101’−02’, 8091’−92’, 8068’−69’, 8058’−59’, 8047’−48’, 8027’−28’, 8016’−17’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE
INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH
WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 580 GAL 16#
LINEAR PAD,  7412 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 40044 GAL 16# DELTA 200
W/138300# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 4931 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 3912 PSIG. ATR 49.9 BPM.
ISIP 2718 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 7. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7998’. PERFORATE UPR/MPR FROM 7980’−81’, 7963’−64’,
7951’−52’, 7940’−41’, 7897’−98’, 7887’−88’, 7872’−73’, 7857’−58’, 7850’−51’, 7820’−21’, 7797’−98’,
7787’−88’@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO
EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5
BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT),
720 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7415 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 27550 GAL
16# DELTA 200 W/96000# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 6076 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 5045 PSIG.
ATR 46.5 BPM. ISIP 2617 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.

12:00 06:00 18.0 0 0 STAGE 8. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7770’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7747’−48’, 7723’−24’, 7706’−07’,
7698’−99’, 7681’−82’, 7620’−21’, 7588’−89’, 7576’−77’, 7566’−67’, 7552’−53’, 7515’−16’, 7510’−11’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 950
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7422 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 28051 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/95500# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 6158 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 4917 PSIG. ATR
45.1 BPM. ISIP 2527 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 9. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7488’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7468’−69’, 7461’−62’, 7448’−49’,
7442’−43’, 7393’−94’, 7386’−87’, 7371’−72’, 7360’−61’, 7353’−54’, 7320’−21’, 7287’−88’, 7261’−62’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 1744
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7321 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9400# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 34077 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/111500# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 6879 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4488 PSIG. ATR
48.8 BPM. ISIP 2338 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 10. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7242’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7222’−23’, 7205’−06’, 7178’−79’,
7155’−56’, 7136’−37’, 7122’−23’, 7108’−09’, 7088’−89’, 7074’−75’,7062’−63’, 7044’−45’, 7036’−37’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 387
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7410 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 49811 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/178300# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 4944 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 2991 PSIG. ATR
49.9 BPM. ISIP 1800 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 6986’. BLED WELL TO 0 PSIG. RDMO CUTTERS WIRELINE &
HALIBURTON SERVICES. SWIFN.

05−19−2012 Reported By BASTIAN / BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $76,210 Daily Total $76,210

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $655,674 Well Total $1,420,007

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036’−9129’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

Page 11

Sundry Number: 25911 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25911 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

STAGE 6. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8188'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8168'-69', 8137'-38', 8128'-29',
8120'-21', 8114'-15', 8101'-02', 8091'-92', 8068'-69', 8058'-59', 8047'-48', 8027'-28', 8016'-17'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE
INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH
WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 580 GAL 16#
LINEAR PAD, 7412 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 40044 GAL 16# DELTA 200
W/138300# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 4931 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 3912 PSIG. ATR 49.9 BPM.
ISIP 2718 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 7. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7998'. PERFORATE UPR/MPR FROM 7980'-81', 7963'-64',
7951'-52', 7940'-41', 7897'-98', 7887'-88', 7872'-73', 7857'-58', 7850'-51', 7820'-21', 7797'-98',
7787'-88'@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO
EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5
BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT),
720 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7415 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 27550 GAL
16# DELTA 200 W/96000# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 6076 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 5045 PSIG.
ATR 46.5 BPM. ISIP 2617 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.

12:00 06:00 18.0 0 0 STAGE 8. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7770'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7747'-48', 7723'-24', 7706'-07',
7698'-99', 7681'-82', 7620'-21', 7588'-89', 7576'-77', 7566'-67', 7552'-53', 7515'-16', 7510'-11'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 950
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7422 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 28051 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/95500# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 6158 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 4917 PSIG. ATR
45.1 BPM. ISIP 2527 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 9. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7488'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7468'-69', 7461'-62', 7448'-49',
7442'-43', 7393'-94', 7386'-87', 7371'-72', 7360'-61', 7353'-54', 7320'-21', 7287'-88', 7261'-62'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 1744
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7321 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9400# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 34077 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/lll500# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 6879 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4488 PSIG. ATR
48.8 BPM. ISIP 2338 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 10. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7242'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7222'-23', 7205'-06', 7178'-79',
7155'-56', 7136'-37', 7122'-23', 7108'-09', 7088'-89', 7074'-75',7062'-63', 7044'-45', 7036'-37'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 387
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7410 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 49811 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/178300# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 4944 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 2991 PSIG. ATR
49.9 BPM. ISIP 1800 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 6986'. BLED WELL TO 0 PSIG. RDMO CUTTERS WIRELINE &
HALIBURTON SERVICES. SWIFN.

05-19-2012 Reported By BASTIAN / BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $76,210 Daily Total $76,210

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $655,674 Well Total $1,420,007

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036'-9129' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

Page 11

RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 MIRU POWELL RIG 1. ND FRAC TREE. NU BOP. RIH W/BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO TAG @ 6986’. RU
TO DRILL PLUGS. TESTED FLOW LINE & BOPE TO 1800 PSI. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT
PLUGS @ 6986’, 7242’, 7488’, 7770’, 7998’, 8188’, 8378’, 8548’, 8754’ & 8946’. CLEAN OUT TO 9231’.
POH, LD EXCESS TBG. LANDED TBG @ 7697’ KB. ND BOP. NU WH. RDMOSU.





TUBING DETAIL				LENGTH





PUMP OFF SUB				1.00’


1 JT 2−3/8 4.7# L−80 TBG			32.46’


XN NIPPLE				1.30’ @ 7662’


235 JTS 2−3/8 4.7# L−80 TBG			7643.18’


BELOW KB				19.00’	


LANDED @				7697.46’ KB 
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Sundry Number: 25911 API Well Number: 43047523950000



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0449 FNL 0471 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

5 /21 /2012

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /21 /2012

May 21, 2012

Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0449 FNL 0471 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

5/21/2012
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
May 21, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/21/2012

RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 05−21−2012

Well Name CWU 1429−15DX Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43−047−52395 Well Class DRIL

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 04−21−2012 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9,603/ 9,647 Property # 091156

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 4.5 Shoe TVD / MD 9,588/ 9,632

KB / GL Elev 4,859/ 4,840

Location Section 15, T9S, R22E, SWSE, 681 FSL & 1838 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 0.0

AFE No 313112 AFE Total 1,673,000 DHC / CWC 762,000/ 911,000

Rig Contr Rig Name TRUE #34 Start Date 03−01−2012 Release Date 05−18−2012

03−01−2012 Reported By CINDY VAN RANKEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION DATA


681’ FSL & 1838’ FEL (SW/SE)


SECTION 15, T9S, R22E


UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH





LAT 40 DEG 01’ 50.12" LONG 109 DEG 25’ 23.52" (NAD 83)


LAT 40 DEG 01’ 50.25", LONG 109 DEG 25’ 21.06" (NAD 27)





TRUE #34


OBJECTIVE: 9603’ TVD/ 9647’ MD, MESAVERDE


DW/GAS


CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECT


DD&A:  CHAPITA DEEP


NATURAL BUTTES FIELD





LEASE: U−0283−A


ELEVATION:  4840’ NAT GL, 4840.2’ PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL WILL BE 4840’) 4859’
KB (19’)


NOTE: MULTI PAD WELL W/CWU 1426−15D, CWU 1428−15D, CWU 1429−15DX, CWU 1430−15D,
CWU 1431−15D





Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 05-21-2012

Well Name CWU 1429-15DX Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43-047-52395 Well Class DRIL

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 04-21-2012 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9,603/ 9,647 Property # 091156

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 4.5 Shoe TVD / MD 9,588/ 9,632

KB / GL Elev 4,859/ 4,840

Location Section 15, T9S, R22E, SWSE, 681 FSL & 1838 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 0.0

AFE No 313112 AFE Total 1,673,000 DHC / CWC 762,000/ 911,000

Rig Contr Rig Name TRUE #34 Start Date 03-01-2012 Release Date 05-18-2012

03-01-2012 Reported By CINDY VAN RANKEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION DATA I

681'FSL & 1838'FEL (SW/SE)T

SECTION 15, T9S, R22El

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAHL

LAT 40 DEG 01' 50.12" LONG 109 DEG 25' 23.52" (NAD 83)T

LAT 40 DEG 01' 50.25", LONG 109 DEG 25' 21.06" (NAD 27)T

TRUE #341

OBJECTIVE: 9603' TVD/ 9647' MD, MESAVERDE T

DW/GAS T

CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECTI

DD&A: CHAPITADEEPT

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD E

LEASE: U-0283-A I

ELEVATION: 4840' NAT GL, 4840.2' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL WILL BE 4840') 4859'
KB (19') i

NOTE: MULTI PAD WELL W/CWU 1426-15D, CWU 1428-15D, CWU 1429-15DX, CWU 1430-15D,
CWU 1431-15DI

RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1429−15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

EOG WI 100%, NRI %

03−12−2012 Reported By GERALD ASHCRAFT

DailyCosts: Drilling $71,185 Completion $0 Daily Total $71,185

Cum Costs: Drilling $71,185 Completion $0 Well Total $71,185

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 60 CRAIG’S BUCKET RIG SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 3/11/12 @ 08:00 AM, SET 60’ OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX. BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 3/8/12 @
10:18 AM.





NOTE: THE SPUD INFORMATION SHOWN ABOVE WAS ORGINALLY FOR THE CWU 1430−15D (API
NO. 43−047−50312) WHICH OCCUPIED THIS LOCATION.  THE NEIGHBORING WELL ON THE PAD
(CWU 1429−15D − API NO. 43−047−50313), HAD TO BE PLUGGED AND ABANDONED DUE TO A
FISH LOST IN THE HOLE ON 03/24/12.  PERMISSION WAS REQUESTED AND RECEIVED FROM
THE BLM & UDOGM TO USE THE CWU 1430−15D SURFACE LOCATION SLOT ON THE PAD AS
THE LOCATION FOR THE CWU 1429−15DX  AS A REPLACEMENT WELL FOR THE CWU 1429−15D
AND MOVE THE 1430−15D SURFACE LOCATION ON THE PAD TO 691’ FSL, 1839’ FEL, SEC. 15,
T9S, R22E.  AS A RESULT THE SPUD INFORMATION SHOWN ABOVE FOR THE CWU 1430−15D
WAS TRANSFERRED TO THE CWU 1429−15DX WELL.  

04−21−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,641 Completion $0 Daily Total $39,641

Cum Costs: Drilling $110,826 Completion $0 Well Total $110,826

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

02:30 05:00 2.5 60 60 SKID TO CWU 1429−15DX.

05:00 06:00 1.0 60 60 WELDING RISER ON CONDUCTOR, RIG ACCEPTED @ 05:00  4/21/2012.

04−22−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,618 Completion $0 Daily Total $36,618

Cum Costs: Drilling $147,445 Completion $0 Well Total $147,445

MD 1,798 TVD 1,780 Progress 1,475 Days 1 MW 9.2 Visc 28.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: REPLACE SWIVEL PACKING

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 60 60 NIPPLE UP RISER ON CONDUCTOR, FLOWLINE.

08:00 09:30 1.5 60 60 PICK UP & SCRIBE DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

09:30 10:30 1.0 60 323 PICK UP BHA  AND TAG @ 323’.

10:30 15:00 4.5 323 647 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 323’ TO 647’ = 324’, ROP 72 FPH,WOB 5−12K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 1650
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 727 GPM, 63% ROTATE, 37% SLIDE.


 

15:00 15:30 0.5 647 647 SERVICE RIG.

15:30 05:00 13.5 647 1798 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 647’ TO 1798’ = 1151’, ROP 85 FPH,WOB 5−12K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 1900
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 727 GPM, 87.8% ROTATE, 12.2% SLIDE.
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Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1429-15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

EOG WI 100%, NRI %

03-12-2012 Reported By GERALD ASHCRAFT

DailyCosts: Drilling $71,185 Completion $0 Daily Total $71,185

Cum Costs: Drilling $71,185 Completion $0 Well Total $71,185

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 60 CRAIG'S BUCKET RIG SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 3/11/12 @08:00 AM, SET 60' OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX. BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 3/8/12 @
10:18 AM.

NOTE: THE SPUD INFORMATION SHOWN ABOVE WAS ORGINALLY FOR THE CWU 1430-15D (API
NO. 43-047-50312) WHICH OCCUPIED THIS LOCATION. THE NEIGHBORING WELL ON THE PAD
(CWU 1429-15D - API NO. 43-047-50313), HAD TO BE PLUGGED AND ABANDONED DUE TO A
FISH LOST IN THE HOLE ON 03/24/12. PERMISSION WAS REQUESTED AND RECEIVED FROM
THE BLM & UDOGM TO USE THE CWU 1430-15D SURFACE LOCATION SLOT ON THE PAD AS
THE LOCATION FOR THE CWU 1429-15DX AS A REPLACEMENT WELL FOR THE CWU 1429-15D

AND MOVE THE 1430-15D SURFACE LOCATION ON THE PAD TO 691'FSL, 1839'FEL, SEC. 15,
T9S, R22E. AS A RESULT THE SPUD INFORMATION SHOWN ABOVE FOR THE CWU 1430-15D

WAS TRANSFERRED TO THE CWU 1429-15DX WELL.

04-21-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,641 Completion $0 Daily Total $39,641

Cum Costs: Drilling $110,826 Completion $0 Well Total $110,826

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

02:30 05:00 2.5 60 60 SKID TO CWU 1429-15DX.

05:00 06:00 1.0 60 60 WELDING RISER ON CONDUCTOR, RIG ACCEPTED @05:00 4/21/2012.

04-22-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,618 Completion $0 Daily Total $36,618

Cum Costs: Drilling $147,445 Completion $0 Well Total $147,445

MD 1,798 TVD 1,780 Progress 1,475 Days 1 MW 9.2 Visc 28.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: REPLACE SWIVEL PACKING

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 60 60 NIPPLE UP RISER ON CONDUCTOR, FLOWLINE.

08:00 09:30 1.5 60 60 PICK UP & SCRIBE DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

09:30 10:30 1.0 60 323 PICK UP BHA AND TAG @323'.

10:30 15:00 4.5 323 647 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 323' TO 647' = 324', ROP 72 FPH,WOB 5-12K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 1650
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 727 GPM, 63% ROTATE, 37% SLIDE.

15:00 15:30 0.5 647 647 SERVICE RIG.

15:30 05:00 13.5 647 1798 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 647' TO 1798' = 1151', ROP 85 FPH,WOB 5-12K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 1900
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 727 GPM, 87.8% ROTATE, 12.2% SLIDE.
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1429−15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

05:00 06:00 1.0 1798 1798 CIRCULATE, ROTATE, WORK PIPE AND CHANGE OUT SWIVEL PACKING.  





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, USING WINCHES, WORKING FROM AIR HOIST..


FUEL, 6156 GALS, USED 1140 GALS





06:00 0 0 SPUD 12 1/4" HOLE @ 10:30 HRS, 4/21/12.

04−23−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $44,311 Completion $0 Daily Total $44,311

Cum Costs: Drilling $191,756 Completion $0 Well Total $191,756

MD 2,354 TVD 2,327 Progress 556 Days 2 MW 9.5 Visc 30.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNNING 9 5/8" CASING

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 1798 2047 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 1798’ TO 2047’ = 249’, ROP 71 FPH,WOB 5−12K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 1900
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 727 GPM, 90.4% ROTATE, 9.6% SLIDE.

09:30 10:00 0.5 2047 2047 SERVICE RIG.

10:00 13:00 3.0 2047 2268 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 2047’ TO 2268’ = 221’, ROP 73.7 FPH,WOB 10−20K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP
2150 PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 727 GPM, 89.2% ROTATE, 10.8% SLIDE.

13:00 13:30 0.5 2268 2268 SWIVEL PACKING.

13:30 14:00 0.5 2268 2311 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 2268’ TO 2311’ = 43’, ROP 86 FPH,WOB 10−20K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 2150
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 727 GPM, 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE.

14:00 15:00 1.0 2311 2311 C/O GREASE RING ON SWIVEL PACKING.

15:00 15:30 0.5 2311 2354 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 2311’ TO 2354’ = 43’, ROP 86 FPH,WOB 10−20K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 2150
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 727 GPM, 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE.

15:30 16:00 0.5 2354 2354 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP.

16:00 19:00 3.0 2354 2354 TRIP OUT TO LD DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND PU REAMER RUN ASSEMBLY.

19:00 21:30 2.5 2354 2354 TRIP IN HOLE WITH RR TRICONE BIT AND ROLLER REAMER, REAM SPOTS AT 485’ AND 1078’,
NO PROBLEMS TO BOTTOM FROM THERE.

21:30 23:00 1.5 2354 2354 CIRCULATE TO CLEAN HOLE FOR 9 5/8" CASING. SPOT 60 BBL 11.5 PPG PILL.

23:00 01:30 2.5 2354 2 STAND BACK 12 STANDS DP AND HWDP, LDDP AND 8" DC.

01:30 02:30 1.0 2354 2354 PJSM, RIG UP WEATHERFORD CASING CREW.

02:30 06:00 3.5 2354 2354 RUNNING 9 5/8" 36# STC K55 CASING AT 1664’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, WORKING IN HIGH TEMP., RUNNING CASING..


FUEL, 5016 GALS, USED 1140 GALS.

04−24−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $18,636 Completion $0 Daily Total $18,636

Cum Costs: Drilling $210,392 Completion $0 Well Total $210,392

MD 2,354 TVD 2,327 Progress 0 Days 3 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/SKID TO CWU 1430−15D/WORT
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Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1429-15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

05:00 06:00 1.0 1798 1798 CIRCULATE, ROTATE, WORK PIPE AND CHANGE OUT SWIVEL PACKING. I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, USING WINCHES, WORKING FROM AIR HOIST..I

FUEL, 6156 GALS, USED 1140 GALSI

06:00 0 0 SPUD 12 1/4" HOLE @10:30 HRS, 4/21/12.

04-23-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $44,311 Completion $0 Daily Total $44,311

Cum Costs: Drilling $191,756 Completion $0 Well Total $191,756

MD 2,354 TVD 2,327 Progress 556 Days 2 MW 9.5 Visc 30.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNNING 9 5/8" CASING

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 1798 2047 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 1798' TO 2047' = 249', ROP 71 FPH,WOB 5-12K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 1900
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 727 GPM, 90.4% ROTATE, 9.6% SLIDE.

09:30 10:00 0.5 2047 2047 SERVICE RIG.

10:00 13:00 3.0 2047 2268 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 2047' TO 2268' = 221', ROP 73.7 FPH,WOB 10-20K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP
2150 PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 727 GPM, 89.2% ROTATE, 10.8% SLIDE.

13:00 13:30 0.5 2268 2268 SWIVEL PACKING.

13:30 14:00 0.5 2268 2311 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 2268' TO 2311' = 43', ROP 86 FPH,WOB 10-20K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 2150
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 727 GPM, 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE.

14:00 15:00 1.0 2311 2311 C/O GREASE RING ON SWIVEL PACKING.

15:00 15:30 0.5 2311 2354 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 2311' TO 2354' = 43', ROP 86 FPH,WOB 10-20K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 2150
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 727 GPM, 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE.

15:30 16:00 0.5 2354 2354 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP.

16:00 19:00 3.0 2354 2354 TRIP OUT TO LD DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND PU REAMER RUN ASSEMBLY.

19:00 21:30 2.5 2354 2354 TRIP IN HOLE WITH RR TRICONE BIT AND ROLLER REAMER, REAM SPOTS AT 485' AND 1078',
NO PROBLEMS TO BOTTOM FROM THERE.

21:30 23:00 1.5 2354 2354 CIRCULATE TO CLEAN HOLE FOR 9 5/8" CASING. SPOT 60 BBL 11.5 PPG PILL.

23:00 01:30 2.5 2354 2 STAND BACK 12 STANDS DP AND HWDP, LDDP AND 8" DC.

01:30 02:30 1.0 2354 2354 PJSM, RIG UP WEATHERFORD CASING CREW.

02:30 06:00 3.5 2354 2354 RUNNING 9 5/8" 36# STC K55 CASING AT 1664'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, WORKING IN HIGH TEMP., RUNNING CASING..I

FUEL, 5016 GALS, USED 1140 GALS.

04-24-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $18,636 Completion $0 Daily Total $18,636

Cum Costs: Drilling $210,392 Completion $0 Well Total $210,392

MD 2,354 TVD 2,327 Progress 0 Days 3 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/SKID TO CWU 1430-15D/WORT
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1429−15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 2354 2354 RUN 56 JTS (2354’) OF 9−5/8", 36.0#, K−55, ST&C CASING WITH HALLIBURTON GUIDE SHOE AND
FLOAT COLLAR. 10 CENTRALIZERS SPACED MIDDLE THE SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2
THROUGH #8 THEN TWO CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @ 2316’ TVD / 2343’ MD. CASING
WENT TO BOTTOM OF RATHOLE @ 2354’.





07:00 09:30 2.5 2354 2354 PUMPING WITH NO RETURNS  ATTEMPTING TO REGAIN CIRCULATION AND CLEAR FLOATS.
PUMPED AWAY 1150 BBL. REGAINED CIRCULATION.

09:30 11:00 1.5 2354 2354 PJSM W/HALLIBURTON, RIG UP/ TEST LINES TO 5000 PSI. PUMPED 20 BBLS GEL/ WATER FLUSH
AHEAD OF CEMENT. LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (182 BBLS) OF HES VARICEM
LEAD CEMENT WITH 0.3% VERSASET, 2% CAL−SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD
CEMENT @ 10.5 PPG WITH YIELD OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63
BBLS) OF HES HALCEM CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2 MIXED @ 15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.18
CF/SX. WASHED UP ON PLUG. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH 177 BBLS FRESH WATER. FINAL PSI
340, BUMPED PLUG WITH 900 PSI. OVER @ 11:00  ON 04/23/12. FLOATS HELD. HAD GOOD
RETURNS WHILE MIXING, & WEAK RETURNS DURING DISPLACEMENT. NO CEMENT OR
SPACER TO SURFACE.





BILL SNAPP NOTIFIED BLM/VERNAL AND CAROL DANIELS/UDOGM/SALT LAKE OF UPCOMING
SURFACE CASING JOB. @ 05:00 HRS. 4/23/12 VIA E−MAILED BLM FORM AT 08:47 HRS. 04/22/12.





11:00 12:30 1.5 2354 2354 CUT OFF CONDUCTOR PIPE, INSTALL CASING ELEVATORS AROUND 9 5/8" CASING BELOW
COLLAR  AND SET CASING ON ELEVATORS. BACK OUT LANDING JOINT, LAY DOWN 14" RISER
AND RUN 75’ OF I" PIPE FROM GL.,TAGG UP TWICE IN SAME SPOT.

12:30 13:00 0.5 2354 2354 TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 75’ OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 50 SX (10 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL. RIG DOWN HALLIBURTON. 





( RIG #34 RELEASED13:00 HRS. 4/23/2012) TO DRILL PRODUCTION HOLE ON CWU 1430−15D,
WILL RESUME THIS REPORT WHEN RETURN TO DRILL PRODUCTION HOLE.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, WORKING IN HIGH TEMP., RUNNING CASING..


FUEL, 4902 GALS, USED 114 GALS.


TRANSFER 4902 GAL. TO CWU 1430−15D

05−08−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP/KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $22,089 Completion $0 Daily Total $22,089

Cum Costs: Drilling $232,482 Completion $0 Well Total $232,482

MD 2,354 TVD 2,327 Progress 0 Days 4 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: NIPPLE UP BOP.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

05:30 06:00 0.5 2354 2354 NIPPLE UP BOP.


RIG ON DAY WORK ON 5/8/2012 AT 05:30 HRS

05−09−2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,053 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,053

Cum Costs: Drilling $273,535 Completion $0 Well Total $273,535

MD 2,925 TVD 2,893 Progress 561 Days 5 MW 9.4 Visc 30.0
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Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1429-15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 2354 2354 RUN 56 JTS (2354') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#, K-55, ST&C CASING WITH HALLIBURTON GUIDE SHOE AND
FLOAT COLLAR. 10 CENTRALIZERS SPACED MIDDLE THE SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2
THROUGH #8 THEN TWO CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @2316' TVD / 2343' MD. CASING
WENT TO BOTTOM OF RATHOLE @

2354'.¯

07:00 09:30 2.5 2354 2354 PUMPING WITH NO RETURNS ATTEMPTING TO REGAIN CIRCULATION AND CLEAR FLOATS.
PUMPED AWAY 1150 BBL. REGAINED CIRCULATION.

09:30 11:00 1.5 2354 2354 PJSM W/HALLIBURTON, RIG UP/ TEST LINES TO 5000 PSI. PUMPED 20 BBLS GEL/ WATER FLUSH
AHEAD OF CEMENT. LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (182 BBLS) OF HES VARICEM
LEAD CEMENT WITH 0.3% VERSASET, 2% CAL-SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD
CEMENT @10.5 PPG WITH YIELD OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63
BBLS) OF HES HALCEM CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2 MIXED @15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.18
CF/SX. WASHED UP ON PLUG. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH 177 BBLS FRESH WATER. FINAL PSI
340, BUMPED PLUG WITH 900 PSI. OVER @ l l:00 ON 04/23/12. FLOATS HELD. HAD GOOD
RETURNS WHILE MIXING, & WEAK RETURNS DURING DISPLACEMENT. NO CEMENT OR
SPACER TO SURFACE.1

BILL SNAPP NOTIFIED BLM/VERNAL AND CAROL DANIELS/UDOGM/SALT LAKE OF UPCOMING
SURFACE CASING JOB. @05:00 HRS. 4/23/12 VIA E-MAILED BLM FORM AT 08:47 HRS. 04/22/12.1

11:00 12:30 1.5 2354 2354 CUT OFF CONDUCTOR PIPE, INSTALL CASING ELEVATORS AROUND 9 5/8" CASING BELOW
COLLAR AND SET CASING ON ELEVATORS. BACK OUT LANDING JOINT, LAY DOWN 14" RISER
AND RUN 75' OF I" PIPE FROM GL.,TAGG UP TWICE IN SAME SPOT.

12:30 13:00 0.5 2354 2354 TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 75' OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 50 SX (10 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL. RIG DOWN HALLIBURTON. 1

( RIG #34 RELEASED13:00 HRS. 4/23/2012) TO DRILL PRODUCTION HOLE ON CWU 1430-15D,
WILL RESUME THIS REPORT WHEN RETURN TO DRILL PRODUCTION HOLE.1

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, WORKING IN HIGH TEMP., RUNNING CASING..I

FUEL, 4902 GALS, USED 114 GALS.I

TRANSFER 4902 GAL. TO CWU 1430-15D

05-08-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP/KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $22,089 Completion $0 Daily Total $22,089

Cum Costs: Drilling $232,482 Completion $0 Well Total $232,482

MD 2,354 TVD 2,327 Progress 0 Days 4 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: NIPPLE UP BOP.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

05:30 06:00 0.5 2354 2354 NIPPLE UP BOP.1

RIG ON DAY WORK ON 5/8/2012 AT 05:30 HRS

05-09-2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,053 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,053

Cum Costs: Drilling $273,535 Completion $0 Well Total $273,535

MD 2,925 TVD 2,893 Progress 561 Days 5 MW 9.4 Visc 30.0
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1429−15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AT 2925’.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 2354 2354 NIPPLE UP BOP.

06:30 11:00 4.5 2354 2354 TEST UPPER & LOWER  KELLY VALVES, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE VALVES, HCR, CHOKE
MANIFOLD, CHECK VALVE, PIPE RAMS & BLIND RAMS TO 5000 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, ANNULAR
2500 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW,  CASING 1500 PSI. FUNCTION KOOMEY AND TEST.


KERY SALES NOTIFYED THE BLM AND UDOGM BY E−MAIL FOR BOP TEST ON 05/04/2012 AT 02:
30  AM.NOTIFICATIONS SENT ON 05/03/2012 AT 09:32 AM. NO REPRESENTATIVE PRESENT.


 

11:00 13:00 2.0 2354 2354 EQUIPMENT REPAIR. WORK ON KELLY SWIVEL.

13:00 13:30 0.5 2354 2354 SERVICE RIG. CHECK COM.

13:30 14:00 0.5 2354 2354 SET WEAR BUSHING.

14:00 15:00 1.0 2354 2354 P/U BHA AND ORIENT TOOL FACE. 

15:00 16:00 1.0 2354 2354 TIH TO 2131’.


   

16:00 17:00 1.0 2354 2354 SLIP & CUT 80’ of DRILL LINE.

17:00 18:00 1.0 2354 2354 TORQUE KELLY, INSTALL DRIVE BUSHING AND INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER.

18:00 21:30 3.5 2354 2354 WELDER TO REPAIR BAIL PIN, CHANGE WASH PIPE PACKING AND INSTALL KELLY SPINNERS.

21:30 23:00 1.5 2354 2364 DRILL SHOE TRAC TOP OF CEMENT 2205’ FLOAT COLLAR AT 2295’ TD 2354’  10’ OF NEW HOLE
TO 2364’.

23:00 23:30 0.5 2364 2364 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP RUN FIT. OMW 9.3 PPG, HELD 160 PSI EMW 10.6 PPG.

23:30 06:00 6.5 2364 0 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 2364’ TO 2925’. 561’. ROP 86’. WOB 20. ROTARY 65, MOTOR 68,
STKS 124 GPM 454. 8% SLIDE AND 92% ROT, TFO 355 L, 32 LEFT AND 18’ ABOVE THE LINE.





06:00 0 0 RESUMED DRILLING 7−7/8" HOLE @ 10:30 PM, 5/8/12

05−10−2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $66,620 Completion $0 Daily Total $66,620

Cum Costs: Drilling $340,156 Completion $0 Well Total $340,156

MD 4,400 TVD 4,356 Progress 1,475 Days 6 MW 10.0 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 4400’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 2925 3649 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 2925’ TO 3649’. 724’. ROP 65.8’. WOB 20, ROTARY 63, MOTOR 68,
STROKES 120, PSI 1600, DIFF PSI 145/160. 12% SLIDE / 88% ROTATE, TFO 130L, 35’ LEFT AND 8.8’
ABOVE THE LINE.  BOP DRILL 90 SECONDS CLOSE ANNULAR.

17:00 17:30 0.5 3649 3649 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION FLOOR VALVES.





17:30 06:00 12.5 3649 4400 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 3649’ TO 4400’. 751’. ROP 62.76’. WOB 20, ROTARY 65, MOTOR
68, STROKES 120, PSI 1685, DIFF PSI 150/260, GPM 454. 10% SLIDE / 90% ROTATE, TFO 50L, 35’
LEFT AND 8.8’. 5’ INSIDE EDGE OF TARGET.  





BOP DRILL 72 SECONDS MEN TO STATION.     

05−11−2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $45,621 Completion $6,759 Daily Total $52,380

Cum Costs: Drilling $385,777 Completion $6,759 Well Total $392,536

Page 5

Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1429-15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLINGAT 2925'.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 2354 2354 NIPPLE UP BOP.

06:30 11:00 4.5 2354 2354 TEST UPPER & LOWER KELLY VALVES, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE VALVES, HCR, CHOKE
MANIFOLD, CHECK VALVE, PIPE RAMS & BLIND RAMS TO 5000 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, ANNULAR
2500 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, CASING 1500 PSI. FUNCTION KOOMEY AND TEST.1

KERY SALES NOTIFYED THE BLM AND UDOGM BY E-MAIL FOR BOP TEST ON 05/04/2012 AT 02:
30 AM.NOTIFICATIONS SENT ON 05/03/2012 AT 09:32 AM. NO REPRESENTATIVE PRESENT.1

11:00 13:00 2.0 2354 2354 EQUIPMENT REPAIR. WORK ON KELLY SWIVEL.

13:00 13:30 0.5 2354 2354 SERVICE RIG. CHECK COM.

13:30 14:00 0.5 2354 2354 SET WEAR BUSHING.

14:00 15:00 1.0 2354 2354 P/U BHA AND ORIENT TOOL FACE.

15:00 16:00 1.0 2354 2354 TIH TO 2131'.I

16:00 17:00 1.0 2354 2354 SLIP & CUT 80' of DRILL LINE.

17:00 18:00 1.0 2354 2354 TORQUE KELLY, INSTALL DRIVE BUSHING AND INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER.

18:00 21:30 3.5 2354 2354 WELDER TO REPAIR BAIL PIN, CHANGE WASH PIPE PACKING AND INSTALL KELLY SPINNERS.

21:30 23:00 1.5 2354 2364 DRILL SHOE TRAC TOP OF CEMENT 2205' FLOAT COLLAR AT 2295' TD 2354' 10' OF NEW HOLE
TO 2364'.

23:00 23:30 0.5 2364 2364 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP RUN FIT. OMW 9.3 PPG, HELD 160 PSI EMW 10.6 PPG.

23:30 06:00 6.5 2364 0 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 2364' TO 2925'. 561'. ROP 86'. WOB 20. ROTARY 65, MOTOR 68,
STKS 124 GPM 454. 8% SLIDE AND 92% ROT, TFO 355 L, 32 LEFT AND 18'ABOVE THE

LINE.¯

06:00 0 0 RESUMED DRILLING 7-7/8" HOLE @10:30 PM, 5/8/12

05-10-2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $66,620 Completion $0 Daily Total $66,620

Cum Costs: Drilling $340,156 Completion $0 Well Total $340,156

MD 4,400 TVD 4,356 Progress 1,475 Days 6 MW 10.0 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @4400'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 2925 3649 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 2925' TO 3649'. 724'. ROP 65.8'. WOB 20, ROTARY 63, MOTOR 68,
STROKES 120, PSI 1600, DIFF PSI 145/160. 12% SLIDE / 88% ROTATE, TFO 130L, 35' LEFT AND 8.8'
ABOVE THE LINE. BOP DRILL 90 SECONDS CLOSE ANNULAR.

17:00 17:30 0.5 3649 3649 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION FLOOR
VALVES.¯

17:30 06:00 12.5 3649 4400 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 3649' TO 4400'. 751'. ROP 62.76'. WOB 20, ROTARY 65, MOTOR
68, STROKES 120, PSI 1685, DIFF PSI 150/260, GPM 454. 10% SLIDE / 90% ROTATE, TFO 50L, 35'
LEFT AND 8.8'. 5' INSIDE EDGE OF TARGET.

-

BOP DRILL 72 SECONDS MEN TO STATION.

05-11-2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $45,621 Completion $6,759 Daily Total $52,380

Cum Costs: Drilling $385,777 Completion $6,759 Well Total $392,536
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1429−15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

MD 5,525 TVD 5,481 Progress 1,125 Days 7 MW 10.2 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 5525’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 11:30 5.5 4400 4744 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 4400’ TO 4744’. 344’. ROP 62.5’. WOB 20, ROTARY 60, MOTOR 68,
STROKES 120, 1960 PSI , DIFF PSI 160/220, GPM 454. 7% SLIDE / 93% ROTATE, TFO 330, NORTH 31’
AND 16.5’ WEST OF CENTER.

11:30 12:00 0.5 4744 4744 SERVICE RIG. CHECK COM, WORK HCR.





12:00 06:00 18.0 4744 5525 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 4744’ TO 5525’. 781’. ROP 43.4’. WOB 16/20, ROTARY 60, MOTOR
68, STROKES 120, 2000 PSI , DIFF PSI 155/290, GPM 454. 100% ROTATE, NORTH 27’  AND 10’ WEST
OF CENTER.

05−12−2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $42,739 Completion $0 Daily Total $42,739

Cum Costs: Drilling $428,516 Completion $6,759 Well Total $435,276

MD 6,760 TVD 6,716 Progress 1,235 Days 8 MW 10.6 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 6760’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 5525 6057 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 5525’ TO 6057’. 532’. ROP 56’. WOB 18/20, ROTARY 60, MOTOR
68, STROKES 120, 2100 PSI, DIFF PSI 130/260, GPM 454. 2% SLIDE AND 98% ROTATE, NORTH 17.9’
AND 5.6’ WEST OF CENTER.  LOST 130 BBLS AT 5580’.

15:30 16:00 0.5 6057 6057 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION SUPER CHOKE.





16:00 06:00 14.0 6057 6760 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 6057’ TO 6760’. 703’. ROP 50.2’. WOB 18/21, ROTARY 55/60,
MOTOR 68, STROKES 120, 2100 PSI, DIFF PSI 150/270, GPM 454. 2% SLIDE AND 98% ROTATE,
NORTH 11.4’  AND 3.2’ WEST OF CENTER.


LOST 60 BBLS TO FORMATION.

05−13−2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $40,996 Completion $0 Daily Total $40,996

Cum Costs: Drilling $469,513 Completion $6,759 Well Total $476,272

MD 7,630 TVD 7,586 Progress 870 Days 9 MW 11.1 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 7630’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 6760 7210 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 6760’ TO 7210’. 450’. ROP 40.9’. WOB 18/21, ROTARY 55/60,
MOTOR 68, STROKES 120, 2430 PSI, DIFF PSI 130/260, GPM 454. TFO 330*, 1% SLIDE AND 99%
ROTATE, NORTH 8’  AND .5’ EAST OF CENTER.

17:00 17:30 0.5 7210 7210 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION HCR VALVE AND COM.





17:30 22:00 4.5 7210 7402 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 7210’ TO 7402’. 192’. ROP 42.7’. WOB 18/21, ROTARY 55/60,
MOTOR 68, STROKES 120, 2360 PSI, DIFF PSI 125/260, GPM 443. 

22:00 22:30 0.5 7402 7402 LOST RETURNS AT 7398. PUMP LCM SWEEP AND REGAINED RETURNS. LOST 250 BBLS.





22:30 06:00 7.5 7402 7630 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 7402’ TO 7630’. 228’. ROP 30.4’. WOB 19/22, ROTARY 55/60,
MOTOR 60, STROKES 115, 2250 PSI, DIFF PSI 120/280, GPM 401. 3% SLIDE, 97% ROTATE, 4’ NORTH
AND 4.5’ EAST OF CENTER.
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Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1429-15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

MD 5,525 TVD 5,481 Progress 1,125 Days 7 MW 10.2 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @5525'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 11:30 5.5 4400 4744 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 4400' TO 4744'. 344'. ROP 62.5'. WOB 20, ROTARY 60, MOTOR 68,
STROKES 120, 1960 PSI , DIFF PSI 160/220, GPM 454. 7% SLIDE / 93% ROTATE, TFO 330, NORTH 31'
AND 16.5' WEST OF CENTER.

11:30 12:00 0.5 4744 4744 SERVICE RIG. CHECK COM, WORK HCR.

12:00 06:00 18.0 4744 5525 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 4744' TO 5525'. 781'. ROP 43.4'. WOB 16/20, ROTARY 60, MOTOR
68, STROKES 120, 2000 PSI , DIFF PSI 155/290, GPM 454. 100% ROTATE, NORTH 27' AND 10' WEST
OF CENTER.

05-12-2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $42,739 Completion $0 Daily Total $42,739

Cum Costs: Drilling $428,516 Completion $6,759 Well Total $435,276

MD 6,760 TVD 6,716 Progress 1,235 Days 8 MW 10.6 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @6760'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 5525 6057 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 5525' TO 6057'. 532'. ROP 56'. WOB 18/20, ROTARY 60, MOTOR
68, STROKES 120, 2100 PSI, DIFF PSI 130/260, GPM 454. 2% SLIDE AND 98% ROTATE, NORTH 17.9'
AND 5.6' WEST OF CENTER. LOST 130 BBLS AT 5580'.

15:30 16:00 0.5 6057 6057 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION SUPER CHOKE.

16:00 06:00 14.0 6057 6760 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 6057' TO 6760'. 703'. ROP 50.2'. WOB 18/21, ROTARY 55/60,
MOTOR 68, STROKES 120, 2100 PSI, DIFF PSI 150/270, GPM 454. 2% SLIDE AND 98% ROTATE,
NORTH 11.4' AND 3.2' WEST OF CENTER.

LOST 60 BBLS TO FORMATION.

05-13-2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $40,996 Completion $0 Daily Total $40,996

Cum Costs: Drilling $469,513 Completion $6,759 Well Total $476,272

MD 7,630 TVD 7,586 Progress 870 Days 9 MW 11.1 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @7630'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 6760 7210 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 6760' TO 7210'. 450'. ROP 40.9'. WOB 18/21, ROTARY 55/60,
MOTOR 68, STROKES 120, 2430 PSI, DIFF PSI 130/260, GPM 454. TFO 330*, 1% SLIDE AND 99%
ROTATE, NORTH 8' AND .5' EAST OF CENTER.

17:00 17:30 0.5 7210 7210 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION HCR VALVE AND COM.

17:30 22:00 4.5 7210 7402 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 7210' TO 7402'. 192'. ROP 42.7'. WOB 18/21, ROTARY 55/60,
MOTOR 68, STROKES 120, 2360 PSI, DIFF PSI 125/260, GPM 443.

22:00 22:30 0.5 7402 7402 LOST RETURNS AT 7398. PUMP LCM SWEEP AND REGAINED RETURNS. LOST 250 BBLS.

22:30 06:00 7.5 7402 7630 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 7402' TO 7630'. 228'. ROP 30.4'. WOB 19/22, ROTARY 55/60,
MOTOR 60, STROKES 115, 2250 PSI, DIFF PSI 120/280, GPM 401. 3% SLIDE, 97% ROTATE, 4' NORTH
AND 4.5' EAST OF CENTER.
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1429−15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

WELL SEEPING 3 TO 4 BBL/HR.


TOTAL LOSSES 450 BBLS TODAY.

05−14−2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $44,409 Completion $0 Daily Total $44,409

Cum Costs: Drilling $513,922 Completion $6,759 Well Total $520,681

MD 8,520 TVD 8,476 Progress 890 Days 10 MW 11.3 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AT 8520’.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:00 10.0 7630 8018 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 7630’ TO 8018’. 388’. ROP 38.8’. WOB 19/21, ROTARY 58/60,
MOTOR 63, STROKES 120, 2355 PSI, DIFF PSI 140/304, GPM 419. 2% SLIDE, 98% ROTATE, 1/2’
NORTH AND 9’ EAST OF CENTER.


LOST 25 BBLS AT 7686’ AND 50 BBLS AT 7841’. TOTAL 75 BBLS.

16:00 16:30 0.5 8018 8018 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION ANNULAR, PIPE RAMS AND COM. 





16:30 06:00 13.5 8018 8018 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 8018’ TO 8520’. 388’. ROP 38.8’. WOB 21/23, ROTARY 50/55,
MOTOR 62, STROKES 118, 2500 PS, DIFF PSI 220/350, GPM 412. 3% SLIDE, 97% ROTATE, 4.5’
SOUTH AND 14.9’ EAST OF CENTER.


MUD LOST TO FORMATION 70 BBLS, SEEPING.

05−15−2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $105,363 Completion $0 Daily Total $105,363

Cum Costs: Drilling $619,286 Completion $6,759 Well Total $626,045

MD 9,140 TVD 9,096 Progress 620 Days 11 MW 11.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AT 9140’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 8520 8520 ON CONNECTION AT 8520 HIT TIGHT HOLE COMMING UP AT 8491’ TO 8489’, 2’. PULLED 20/30
OVER PICK UP WT AND HOLE WAS PACKING OFF. WORK THROUGH TIGHT SPOT BACK
REAMING, RUN THROUGH 3 MORE TIMES OK. RAISING MW F/ 11.3+ PPG TO 11.7 PPG.  2’ FLAIR
AT 8484’ BOTTOMS UP DEPTH. RUNNING THROUGH GAS BUSTER.





06:30 14:30 8.0 8520 8803 ROTATE FROM 8520’ TO 8803’. 283’. ROP 35.4’. WOB 21/23, ROTARY 45/55, MOTOR 62, STROKES
118, 2500 PSI , DIFF PSI 130/350, GPM 412. 100% ROTATE, 19’ SOUTH AND 9’ EAST OF CENTER.

14:30 15:00 0.5 8803 8803 SERVICE RIG. CHECK FLOOR VALVES AND FUNCTION HCR VALVE.





15:00 06:00 15.0 8803 9140 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 8803’ TO 9140’. 337’. ROP 22.5’. WOB 21/24, WOB SLIDING 16/24,
ROTARY 48/50, MOTOR 59, STROKES 112, 2500 PSI , DIFF PSI 130/340, GPM 412. 14% SLIDE AND
86% ROTATE, 18.6’ SOUTH AND 23.5’ EAST OF CENTER.


LOST 250 BBLS TO FORMATION.


TOTAL LOST 370 BBLS.

05−16−2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $58,758 Completion $144 Daily Total $58,902

Cum Costs: Drilling $678,044 Completion $6,903 Well Total $684,948

MD 9,647 TVD 9,603 Progress 507 Days 12 MW 12.0 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1429-15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

WELL SEEPING 3 TO 4 BBL/HR.I

TOTAL LOSSES 450 BBLS TODAY

05-14-2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $44,409 Completion $0 Daily Total $44,409

Cum Costs: Drilling $513,922 Completion $6,759 Well Total $520,681

MD 8,520 TVD 8,476 Progress 890 Days 10 MW 11.3 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLINGAT 8520'.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:00 10.0 7630 8018 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 7630' TO 8018'. 388'. ROP 38.8'. WOB 19/21, ROTARY 58/60,
MOTOR 63, STROKES 120, 2355 PSI, DIFF PSI 140/304, GPM 419. 2°o SLIDE, 98°o ROTATE, 1/2'
NORTH AND 9' EAST OF CENTER.I

LOST 25 BBLS AT 7686'AND 50 BBLS AT 7841'. TOTAL 75 BBLS.

16:00 16:30 0.5 8018 8018 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION ANNULAR, PIPE RAMS AND COM. I

16:30 06:00 13.5 8018 8018 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 8018' TO 8520'. 388'. ROP 38.8'. WOB 21/23, ROTARY 50/55,
MOTOR 62, STROKES 118, 2500 PS, DIFF PSI 220/350, GPM 412. 3°o SLIDE, 97°o ROTATE, 4.5'
SOUTH AND 14.9' EAST OF CENTER.I

MUD LOST TO FORMATION 70 BBLS, SEEPING.

05-15-2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $105,363 Completion $0 Daily Total $105,363

Cum Costs: Drilling $619,286 Completion $6,759 Well Total $626,045

MD 9,140 TVD 9,096 Progress 620 Days 11 MW 11.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLINGAT 9140'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 8520 8520 ON CONNECTION AT 8520 HIT TIGHT HOLE COMMING UP AT 8491' TO 8489', 2'. PULLED 20/30
OVER PICK UP WT AND HOLE WAS PACKING OFF. WORK THROUGH TIGHT SPOT BACK
REAMING, RUN THROUGH 3 MORE TIMES OK. RAISING MW F/ 11.3+ PPG TO 11.7 PPG. 2'FLAIR
AT 8484' BOTTOMS UP DEPTH. RUNNING THROUGH GAS BUSTER.I

06:30 14:30 8.0 8520 8803 ROTATE FROM 8520' TO 8803'. 283'. ROP 35.4'. WOB 21/23, ROTARY 45/55, MOTOR 62, STROKES
118, 2500 PSI , DIFF PSI 130/350, GPM 412. 100°o ROTATE, 19' SOUTH AND 9' EAST OF CENTER.

14:30 15:00 0.5 8803 8803 SERVICE RIG. CHECK FLOOR VALVES AND FUNCTION HCR VALVE.1

15:00 06:00 15.0 8803 9140 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 8803' TO 9140'. 337'. ROP 22.5'. WOB 21/24, WOB SLIDING 16/24,
ROTARY 48/50, MOTOR 59, STROKES 112, 2500 PSI , DIFF PSI 130/340, GPM 412. 14°o SLIDE AND
86°o ROTATE, 18.6' SOUTH AND 23.5' EAST OF CENTER.I

LOST 250 BBLS TO FORMATION.1

TOTAL LOST 370 BBLS.

05-16-2012 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $58,758 Completion $144 Daily Total $58,902

Cum Costs: Drilling $678,044 Completion $6,903 Well Total $684,948

MD 9,647 TVD 9,603 Progress 507 Days 12 MW 12.0 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1429−15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

Activity at Report Time: WIPER TRIP

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 9140 9398 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 9140’ TO 9398’. 258’. ROP 28.7’. WOB 21/23, WOB SLIDING 38/40,
ROTARY 48/50, MOTOR 59, STROKES 115, GPM 401 2600 PSI , DIFF PSI 130/315. 13% SLIDE AND
87% ROTATE, 27.5’ SOUTH AND 28’ EAST OF CENTER.


NO FLUID LOSS.

15:00 15:30 0.5 9398 9398 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION PIPE RAMS.





15:30 00:00 8.5 9398 9647 ROTATE DRILL FROM 9398’ TO 9647’ (TD). 249’. ROP 29.3’. WOB 22/23, ROTARY 47/50, MOTOR 59,
STROKES 112, GPM 391, 2550 PSI , DIFF PSI 160/270. 100% ROTATE, 30.94’ SOUTH AND 33.02’ EAST
OF CENTER.





TD ON 5/16/2012 AT 00:05 HRS.


MD/TVD 44.76’.





00:00 01:30 1.5 9647 9647 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP. 35 MIN IN TO CIR 6’ FLAIR AND DIED OUT. AT BOTTOMS UP 4’ FLARE
AND DIED OUT.

01:30 02:00 0.5 9647 9647 FLOW CHECK. BALLOONED BACK 63 BBLS AND DIED OFF.

02:00 04:00 2.0 9647 9647 PUMP 60 BBL 2.4# OVER SLUG AND TOH FROM 9647 TO 5465’.

04:00 05:30 1.5 9647 9647 WORK TIGHT HOLE FROM 5465’. 5445, 5435’, 5407’, 5378’ AND 5352’. 113’ TOTAL.

05:30 06:00 0.5 9647 9647 CONTINUE TOH FROM 5352’ TO 4743’. ANOTHER TIGHT SPOT AT 4743’.

05−17−2012 Reported By KERRY SALES/BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $37,850 Completion $0 Daily Total $37,850

Cum Costs: Drilling $715,895 Completion $6,903 Well Total $722,798

MD 9,647 TVD 9,603 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 12.2 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: CIRCULATE PRIOR TO LDDP

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 9647 9647 CONTINUE TOH FROM 4743’ WITH NO OTHER PROBLEMS.

09:00 10:30 1.5 9647 9647 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

10:30 18:30 8.0 9647 9647 TIH, W/R AND WORK TIGHT SPOTS @  4743’, 5352’, 5378, 5407, 5435’, FOUND NOTHING AT 5445’
NOR  5465’. WORKED THROUGH EACH SPOT WITH STRAIGHT PULL. NO PUMP NOR ROTARY. NO
DRAG. TIH TO 6177’, W/R TO 6211’, WORK PIPE THROUGH SPOT, SPOT CLEAN, TIH TO 9522’, NO
PROBLEMS, W/R TO BOTTOM WITH SINGLES TO MAKE UP FOR DIRECTIONAL TOOLS. 15’ OF
FILL.





18:30 20:00 1.5 9647 9647 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP PLUS 10%, YIELDING 3’ TO 5’ FLARE LASTING 5 MIN.

20:00 01:00 5.0 9647 9647 CHECK FLOW, PUMP SLUG AND TOOH TO 2241’ AT 42 TO 45 FT/MIN. USING PIPE SPINNERS,
NORMAL DRAG.

01:00 04:30 3.5 9647 9647 TRIP BACK IN HOLE F/2241’ TO 9647’, NORMAL DRAG, W/R 40’ TO BOTTOM, 10’ FILL.

04:30 06:00 1.5 9647 9647 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP AND RIG UP FRANKS LD MACHINE, 3’ FLARE LASTING 5 MIN.

05−18−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $52,298 Completion $92,848 Daily Total $145,146

Cum Costs: Drilling $768,193 Completion $99,751 Well Total $867,945

MD 9,647 TVD 9,603 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 12.1 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Page 8

Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1429-15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

Activity at Report Time: WIPER TRIP

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 9140 9398 ROTATE AND SLIDE DRILL FROM 9140' TO 9398'. 258'. ROP 28.7'. WOB 21/23, WOB SLIDING 38/40,
ROTARY 48/50, MOTOR 59, STROKES 115, GPM 401 2600 PSI , DIFF PSI 130/315. 13% SLIDE AND
87% ROTATE, 27.5' SOUTH AND 28' EAST OF CENTER.I

NO FLUID LOSS.

15:00 15:30 0.5 9398 9398 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION PIPE RAMS.I

15:30 00:00 8.5 9398 9647 ROTATE DRILL FROM 9398' TO 9647' (TD). 249'. ROP 29.3'. WOB 22/23, ROTARY 47/50, MOTOR 59,
STROKES 112, GPM 391, 2550 PSI , DIFF PSI 160/270. 100% ROTATE, 30.94' SOUTH AND 33.02' EAST
OF CENTER.I

TD ON 5/16/2012 AT 00:05 HRS.I

MD/TVD 44.76'.I

00:00 01:30 1.5 9647 9647 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP. 35 MIN IN TO CIR 6'FLAIRAND DIED OUT. AT BOTTOMS UP 4'FLARE
AND DIED OUT.

01:30 02:00 0.5 9647 9647 FLOW CHECK. BALLOONED BACK 63 BBLS AND DIED OFF.

02:00 04:00 2.0 9647 9647 PUMP 60 BBL 2.4# OVER SLUG AND TOH FROM 9647 TO 5465'.

04:00 05:30 1.5 9647 9647 WORK TIGHT HOLE FROM 5465'. 5445, 5435', 5407', 5378'AND 5352'. 113' TOTAL.

05:30 06:00 0.5 9647 9647 CONTINUE TOH FROM 5352' TO 4743'. ANOTHER TIGHT SPOT AT 4743'.

05-17-2012 Reported By KERRY SALES/BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $37,850 Completion $0 Daily Total $37,850

Cum Costs: Drilling $715,895 Completion $6,903 Well Total $722,798

MD 9,647 TVD 9,603 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 12.2 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: CIRCULATE PRIOR TO LDDP

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 9647 9647 CONTINUE TOH FROM 4743' WITH NO OTHER PROBLEMS.

09:00 10:30 1.5 9647 9647 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

10:30 18:30 8.0 9647 9647 TIH, W/R AND WORK TIGHT SPOTS @ 4743', 5352', 5378, 5407, 5435', FOUND NOTHINGAT 5445'
NOR 5465'. WORKED THROUGH EACH SPOT WITH STRAIGHT PULL. NO PUMP NOR ROTARY. NO
DRAG. TIH TO 6177', W/R TO 6211', WORK PIPE THROUGH SPOT, SPOT CLEAN, TIH TO 9522', NO
PROBLEMS, W/R TO BOTTOM WITH SINGLES TO MAKE UP FOR DIRECTIONAL TOOLS. 15' OF
FILL.

18:30 20:00 1.5 9647 9647 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP PLUS 10%,YIELDING 3' TO 5'FLARE LASTING 5 MIN.

20:00 01:00 5.0 9647 9647 CHECK FLOW, PUMP SLUG AND TOOH TO 2241' AT 42 TO 45 FT/MIN. USING PIPE SPINNERS,
NORMAL DRAG.

01:00 04:30 3.5 9647 9647 TRIP BACK IN HOLE F/2241' TO 9647', NORMAL DRAG, W/R 40' TO BOTTOM, 10'FILL.

04:30 06:00 1.5 9647 9647 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP AND RIG UP FRANKS LD MACHINE, 3'FLARE LASTING 5 MIN.

05-18-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $52,298 Completion $92,848 Daily Total $145,146

Cum Costs: Drilling $768,193 Completion $99,751 Well Total $867,945

MD 9,647 TVD 9,603 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 12.1 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1429−15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

Activity at Report Time: CEMENTING PRODUCTION CSG

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 9647 9647 CIRCULATE, CHECK FLOW, PUMP SLUG.

06:30 16:00 9.5 9647 9647 LD/DRILL PIPE, WIPE SPOT @ 6116’ AND 4750’.

16:00 16:30 0.5 9647 9647 PULL WEAR BUSHING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 9647 9647 PJSM W/RIG UP FRANKS CASING CREW.





17:30 01:00 7.5 9647 9647 RUN TOTAL OF 214 JTS OF CASING (212 FULL JTS  OF 4.5", 11.6#, N−80, LT&C + 2 MARKER
JOINTS 11.6#, P−110, LTC) AS FOLLOWS:  FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, 51 JTS OF
CASING, MARKER JOINT, @ TOP OF PRICE RIVER, 63 JTS CASING, MARKER JOINT @ 400’
ABOVE WASATCH, 97 JTS CASING.  RAN 3 TURBILIZERS (5’ ABOVE SHOE AND MIDDLE OF JTS
#2 & #3) + 1 BOW CENTRALIZER ON 4TH JOINT THEN EVERY 3RD JOINT THEREAFTER TO 400’
ABOVE WASATCH (TOTAL OF 39).  TAG BOTTOM, LAY DOWN TAG JOINT, PICK UP MANDREL &
LAND CASING W/80K STRING WEIGHT @ 9632’.  CASING WENT TO BOTTOM W/NO HOLE
PROBLEMS.





CASING LANDED @ 01:00  AS FOLLOWS (DEPTHS SHOWN ARE TOPS OF 


COMPONENTS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED):


FLOAT SHOE (BOTTOM): 9632’


FLOAT COLLAR: 9587’


MARKER JOINT: 7276’


MARKER JOINT: 4411’

01:00 03:30 2.5 9647 9647 CIRCULATE 1 1/2  BOTTOMS UP, RIG DOWN FRANKS CASING CREW, PJSM, RIG UP
HALLIBURTON. LAST 200 BBL MUD CONTAINING .5 GPT GA 25. NO FLARE.





03:30 06:00 2.5 9647 9647 TEST LINE TO 5000 PSI.  PUMP 20 BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 BBLS FRESH
WATER W/0.5 GPT XCIDE.  PUMP 480 SKS (138 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61 YIELD W/6% BENTONITE,
0.3% VERSASET, 0.5% HR−5 OF LEAD CEMENT.  PUMPED 1310 SKS (343 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47
YIELD W/0.125 LBM POLY−E−FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT.  WASHING PUMP AND LINES,
PREPARING TO  DISPLACE @ REPORT TIME.  FULL RETURNS THROUGH PUMPING CEMENT.
DETAILS TO FOLLOW ON TOMORROW’S REPORT.

05−19−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling ($8,682) Completion $60,042 Daily Total $51,359

Cum Costs: Drilling $759,511 Completion $159,793 Well Total $919,305

MD 9,647 TVD 9,603 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 9647 9647 TEST LINE TO 5000 PSI, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH
WATER W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 480 SKS (138 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61 YIELD W/ 6% BENTONITE,
0.3% VERSASET, 0.5% HR−5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1310 SKS (343 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47 YIELD W/
0.125 LBM POLY−E−FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT,  DISPLACED W/ 148 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5
GPT MYACIDE, DISPLACED @ 8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 2 BBLS MIN W/ 140 BBLS GONE, FCP
2450 PSI, BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3930#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT,  FLOATS
HELD 2 BBLS BACK. FULL RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB. LOOKED LIKE STARTED GETTING
PREFLUSH @ FLOWLINE WHEN BUMPED PLUG. NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. 


 

06:30 07:30 1.0 9647 9647 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# ON CASING & HOLD FOR 1 HR.

07:30 08:30 1.0 9647 9647 SET PACK OFF & TEST TO 5000# FOR 15 MIN.

08:30 10:30 2.0 0 0 NIPPLE DOWN BOP, CLEAN MUD TANKS.
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Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1429-15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

Activity at Report Time: CEMENTING PRODUCTION CSG

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 9647 9647 CIRCULATE, CHECK FLOW, PUMP SLUG.

06:30 16:00 9.5 9647 9647 LD/DRILL PIPE, WIPE SPOT @6116'AND 4750'.

16:00 16:30 0.5 9647 9647 PULL WEAR BUSHING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 9647 9647 PJSM W/RIG UP FRANKS CASING CREW.1

17:30 01:00 7.5 9647 9647 RUN TOTAL OF 214 JTS OF CASING (212 FULL JTS OF 4.5", 11.6#, N-80, LT&C + 2 MARKER
JOINTS 11.6#, P-110, LTC) AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, 51 JTS OF
CASING, MARKER JOINT, @TOP OF PRICE RIVER, 63 JTS CASING, MARKER JOINT @400'
ABOVE WASATCH, 97 JTS CASING. RAN 3 TURBILIZERS (5'ABOVE SHOE AND MIDDLE OF JTS
#2 & #3) + 1 BOW CENTRALIZER ON 4TH JOINT THEN EVERY 3RD JOINT THEREAFTER TO 400'
ABOVE WASATCH (TOTAL OF 39). TAG BOTTOM, LAY DOWN TAG JOINT, PICK UP MANDREL &
LAND CASING W/80K STRING WEIGHT @9632'. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM W/NO HOLE
PROBLEMS.I

CASING LANDED @01:00 AS FOLLOWS (DEPTHS SHOWN ARE TOPS OF I

COMPONENTS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED):I

FLOAT SHOE (BOTTOM): 9632'l

FLOAT COLLAR: 9587'l

MARKER JOINT: 7276'l

MARKER JOINT: 4411'

01:00 03:30 2.5 9647 9647 CIRCULATE 1 1/2 BOTTOMS UP, RIG DOWN FRANKS CASING CREW, PJSM, RIG UP
HALLIBURTON. LAST 200 BBL MUD CONTAINING .5 GPT GA 25. NO FLARE.1

03:30 06:00 2.5 9647 9647 TEST LINE TO 5000 PSI. PUMP 20 BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 BBLS FRESH
WATER W/0.5 GPT XCIDE. PUMP 480 SKS (138 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61 YIELD W/6% BENTONITE,
0.3% VERSASET, 0.5% HR-5 OF LEAD CEMENT. PUMPED 1310 SKS (343 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47
YIELD W/0.125 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT. WASHING PUMP AND LINES,
PREPARING TO DISPLACE @REPORT TIME. FULL RETURNS THROUGH PUMPING CEMENT.
DETAILS TO FOLLOW ON TOMORROW'S REPORT.

05-19-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling ($8,682) Completion $60,042 Daily Total $51,359

Cum Costs: Drilling $759,511 Completion $159,793 Well Total $919,305

MD 9,647 TVD 9,603 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 9647 9647 TEST LINE TO 5000 PSI, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH
WATER W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 480 SKS (138 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61 YIELD W/ 6% BENTONITE,
0.3% VERSASET, 0.5% HR-5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1310 SKS (343 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47YIELD W/
0.125 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 148 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5

GPT MYACIDE, DISPLACED @8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 2 BBLS MIN W/ 140 BBLS GONE, FCP
2450 PSI, BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3930#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT, FLOATS
HELD 2 BBLS BACK. FULL RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB. LOOKED LIKE STARTED GETTING
PREFLUSH @FLOWLINE WHEN BUMPED PLUG. NO CEMENT TO SURFACE.

-

06:30 07:30 1.0 9647 9647 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# ON CASING & HOLD FOR 1 HR.

07:30 08:30 1.0 9647 9647 SET PACK OFF & TEST TO 5000#FOR 15 MIN.

08:30 10:30 2.0 0 0 NIPPLE DOWN BOP, CLEAN MUD
TANKS.¯
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1429−15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

RELEASE RIG ON 5/18/2012 AT 10:30 HRS AM.


DIESEL TRANSFERRED TO CWU 1431−15D, 7481 GALS @ 3.77 PER GALLON. TOTAL $28,203.37. 

Page 10

Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25918 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1429-15DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 091156

RELEASE RIG ON 5/18/2012 AT 10:30 HRS
AM.¯

DIESEL TRANSFERRED TO CWU 1431-15D, 7481 GALS @3.77 PER GALLON. TOTAL $28,203.37.
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0449 FNL 0471 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

5 /21 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The referenced well was turned to sales on 05/21/2012. Please see the
attached operations summary report for drilling and completion

operations performed on the subject well.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /23 /2012

May 23, 2012

Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well Chapita Wells Unit 1542-26DX

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047523950000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0449 FNL 0471 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/21/2012
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was turned to sales on 05/21/2012. Please see the Accepted by the
attached operations summary report for drilling and completion Utah Division of

operations performed on the subject well. Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
May 23, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/23/2012

RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 05−23−2012

Well Name CWU 1542−26DX Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43−047−52395 Well Class 1SA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 03−27−2012 Class Date 05−21−2012

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9,315/ 9,371 Property # 090334

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 7,697/ 7,697

KB / GL Elev 5,034/ 5,015

Location Section 26, T9S, R22E, NENE, 449 FNL & 471 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.139

AFE No 313046 AFE Total 1,607,700 DHC / CWC 761,800/ 845,900

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #34 Start Date 02−11−2012 Release Date 04−07−2012

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #34 Start Date 03−27−2012 Release Date

Rig Contr POWELL SER.
INC

Rig Name RIG 1 Start Date 05−18−2012 Release Date

02−11−2012 Reported By CINDY VAN RANKEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,750 Completion $0 Daily Total $36,750

Cum Costs: Drilling $36,750 Completion $0 Well Total $36,750

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION DATA


449’ FNL & 471’ FEL (NE/NE)


SECTION 26, T9S, R22E


UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH





LAT 40 DEG 00’ 46.82", LONG 109 DEG 23’ 57.97"  (NAD 83)


LAT 40 DEG 00’ 46.95", LONG 109 DEG 23’ 55.51"  (NAD 27)





BHL: 659’ FNL & 19’ FWL (NWNW)


SECTION 25, T9S, R22E


UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH





TRUE #34


OBJECTIVE: 9367’ MD, 9315’ TVD, MESAVERDE


DW/GAS


CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECT


DD&A:  CHAPITA DEEP


NATURAL BUTTES FIELD


Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 05-23-2012

Well Name CWU 1542-26DX Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43-047-52395 Well Class 1SA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 03-27-2012 Class Date 05-21-2012

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9,315/ 9,371 Property # 090334

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 7,697/ 7,697

KB / GL Elev 5,034/ 5,015

Location Section 26, T9S, R22E, NENE, 449 FNL & 471 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.139

AFE No 313046 AFE Total 1,607,700 DHC / CWC 761,800/ 845,900

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #34 Start Date 02-11-2012 Release Date 04-07-2012

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #34 Start Date 03-27-2012 Release Date

Rig Contr POWELL SER. Rig Name RIG 1 Start Date 05-18-2012 Release Date
INC

02-11-2012 Reported By CINDY VAN RANKEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,750 Completion $0 Daily Total $36,750

Cum Costs: Drilling $36,750 Completion $0 Well Total $36,750

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION DATA I

449' FNL & 471' FEL (NE/NE) T

SECTION 26, T9S, R22El

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAHL

LAT 40 DEG 00'46.82", LONG 109 DEG 23' 57.97" (NAD 83)T

LAT 40 DEG 00'46.95", LONG 109 DEG 23' 55.51" (NAD 27)T

BHL: 659'FNL & 19'FWL (NWNW)T

SECTION 25, T9S, R22El

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAHL

TRUE #341

OBJECTIVE: 9367' MD, 9315' TVD, MESAVERDE T

DW/GAS T

CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECTI

DD&A: CHAPITADEEPT

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD E

RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334




LEASE: FEDERAL UTU0285A





ELEVATION: 5014.8’ NAT GL, 5015.3’ PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL IS 5015’), 5034’ KB
(19’)


NOTE:  MULTI PAD CWU 1541−26D, CWU 1542−26DX, CWU 1543−26D, CWU 1544−26D, CWU 1545−
26D, CWU 1546−26D





EOG WI 100%, NRI 82.139316%

02−12−2012 Reported By GERALD L ASHCRAFT

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $36,750 Completion $0 Well Total $36,750

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 60 CRAIG’S BUCKET RIG SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 2/11/12 @ 09:00 AM, SET 60’ OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX.





BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 2/10/12 @ 09:22 AM.

03−28−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $75,658 Completion $0 Daily Total $75,658

Cum Costs: Drilling $112,408 Completion $0 Well Total $112,408

MD 213 TVD 213 Progress 154 Days 1 MW 9.0 Visc 27.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 213’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 0 0 SKID SUB BACK 20’ TO CWU 1542−26DX. MOVE PUMPS AND PITS BACK 10’.

10:30 16:00 5.5 0 0 RIG UP ROTARY TOOLS.

16:00 21:00 5.0 0 0 NU RISER ON CONDUCTOR PIPE. RIG ACCEPTED ON DAYWORK @ 16:00 HRS. 3/27/2012.





21:00 22:30 1.5 0 0 LOAD RACK, STRAP AND CALIPER BHA.

22:30 23:00 0.5 0 59 PU MOTOR, BIT AND TAG BOTTOM @ 59’.

23:00 01:00 2.0 59 164 DRILLING F/59’ TO 164’.

01:00 02:00 1.0 164 164 LAY DOWN 8" DC’S.

02:00 04:00 2.0 164 164 PU MWD TOOLS & SCRIBE.

04:00 06:00 2.0 164 213 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 164’ TO 213’ = 49’, ROP 24.5 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 120 RPM.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: RIGGING UP, PICKING UP TOOLS.


FUEL: 6498 GALS., USED 228 GALS

06:00 0 0 SPUD SURFACE HOLE AT 23:00 HRS, 3/27/12.

Page 2

Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

LEASE: FEDERAL UTU0285Al

ELEVATION: 5014.8' NAT GL, 5015.3' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL IS 5015'), 5034' KB
(19') T

NOTE: MULTI PAD CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26DX, CWU 1543-26D, CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-

26D, CWU 1546-26DI

EOG WI 100%, NRI 82.139316%

02-12-2012 Reported By GERALD L ASHCRAFT

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $36,750 Completion $0 Well Total $36,750

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 60 CRAIG'S BUCKET RIG SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 2/11/12 @09:00 AM, SET 60' OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX.1

BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 2/10/12 @09:22 AM.

03-28-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $75,658 Completion $0 Daily Total $75,658

Cum Costs: Drilling $112,408 Completion $0 Well Total $112,408

MD 213 TVD 213 Progress 154 Days 1 MW 9.0 Visc 27.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @213'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 0 0 SKID SUB BACK 20' TO CWU 1542-26DX. MOVE PUMPS AND PITS BACK 10'.

10:30 16:00 5.5 0 0 RIG UP ROTARY TOOLS.

16:00 21:00 5.0 0 0 NU RISER ON CONDUCTOR PIPE. RIG ACCEPTED ON DAYWORK @16:00 HRS. 3/27/2012.1

21:00 22:30 1.5 0 0 LOAD RACK, STRAP AND CALIPER BHA.

22:30 23:00 0.5 0 59 PU MOTOR, BIT AND TAG BOTTOM @59'.

23:00 01:00 2.0 59 164 DRILLING F/59' TO 164'.

01:00 02:00 1.0 164 164 LAY DOWN 8" DC'S.

02:00 04:00 2.0 164 164 PU MWD TOOLS & SCRIBE.

04:00 06:00 2.0 164 213 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 164' TO 213' = 49', ROP 24.5 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 120 RPM.

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: RIGGING UP, PICKING UP TOOLS.I

FUEL: 6498 GALS., USED 228 GALS

06:00 0 0 SPUD SURFACE HOLE AT 23:00 HRS, 3/27/12.
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

03−29−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,439 Completion $0 Daily Total $36,439

Cum Costs: Drilling $148,847 Completion $0 Well Total $148,847

MD 2,035 TVD 1,936 Progress 1,822 Days 2 MW 9.2 Visc 28.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 2035’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 213 641 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 213’ TO 641’ = 428’, ROP 61 FPH,WOB 5−15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 1050
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 726 GPM, 62% ROTATE, 38% SLIDE.

13:00 13:30 0.5 641 641 SERVICE RIG.

13:30 06:00 16.5 641 2035 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 641’ TO 2035’ = 1394’, ROP 84.5 FPH,WOB 5−15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 1950
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 726 GPM, 65% ROTATE, 35% SLIDE. GREEN RIVER @ 1528’, BIRDSNEST @
1760’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING:  PICKING UP TOOLS., DRLG. SURFACE.


FUEL: 5016 GALS., USED 1482 GALS

03−30−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $103,592 Completion $0 Daily Total $103,592

Cum Costs: Drilling $252,439 Completion $0 Well Total $252,439

MD 2,283 TVD 2,229 Progress 248 Days 3 MW 9.2 Visc 27.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PUMP TOP OUT CEMENT JOB

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 2035 2283 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 2035’ TO 2283’ = 248’, ROP 55 FPH,WOB 5−15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116,  SPP 1950
PSI, DIFF. 175−300, 726 GPM, 65% ROTATE, 35% SLIDE.

10:30 11:30 1.0 2283 2283 CIRCULATE FOR TOOH TO LD DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

11:30 14:30 3.0 2283 2283 TOOH, W/PIPE SPINNERS AND LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

14:30 17:30 3.0 2283 2283 PU TRI CONE BIT, ROLLER REAMER AND TIH. 

17:30 19:00 1.5 2283 2283 CIRCULATE AND ROTATE TO CLEAN HOLE FOR CASING. SPOT 50 BBL. 11.7 PPG. MUD ON
BOTTOM.

19:00 21:00 2.0 2283 2283 TRIP OUT FOR 9 5/8" CASING, LD 8" BHA  AND 9 STANDS DP. 





21:00 02:30 5.5 2283 2283 PJSM W/WEATHERFORD,RUN 55 JTS (2276.67’) OF 9−5/8", 36.0#, K−55, ST&C CASING WITH
HALLIBURTON FLOAT SHOE AND FLOAT COLLAR. 12 CENTRALIZERS SPACED 10’ FROM THE
SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2 AND #3 THEN EVERY 5TH COLLAR TO SURFACE. ALSO 2
CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @ 2222.71’ TVD / 2273.67’ MD. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM,
INCLUDING 10’ OF RATHOLE W/TAG JOINT. NO RETURNS WHEN CIRCULATING AT CASING
POINT. PREASURE BUILT TO 120 PSI, THEN DROPPED TO 35 PSI. NO RETURNS. PUMPED 200
BBL. TO CLEAR FLOATS.
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Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

03-29-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,439 Completion $0 Daily Total $36,439

Cum Costs: Drilling $148,847 Completion $0 Well Total $148,847

MD 2,035 TVD 1,936 Progress 1,822 Days 2 MW 9.2 Visc 28.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @2035'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 213 641 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 213' TO 641' = 428', ROP 61 FPH,WOB 5-15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 1050
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 726 GPM, 62% ROTATE, 38% SLIDE.

13:00 13:30 0.5 641 641 SERVICE RIG.

13:30 06:00 16.5 641 2035 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 641' TO 2035' = 1394', ROP 84.5 FPH,WOB 5-15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 1950
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 726 GPM, 65% ROTATE, 35% SLIDE. GREEN RIVER @1528', BIRDSNEST @
1760'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: PICKING UP TOOLS., DRLG. SURFACE.1

FUEL: 5016 GALS., USED 1482 GALS

03-30-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $103,592 Completion $0 Daily Total $103,592

Cum Costs: Drilling $252,439 Completion $0 Well Total $252,439

MD 2,283 TVD 2,229 Progress 248 Days 3 MW 9.2 Visc 27.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PUMP TOP OUT CEMENT JOB

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 2035 2283 ROTATE & SLIDE F/ 2035' TO 2283' = 248', ROP 55 FPH,WOB 5-15K, RPM 50/60, MM 116, SPP 1950
PSI, DIFF. 175-300, 726 GPM, 65% ROTATE, 35% SLIDE.

10:30 11:30 1.0 2283 2283 CIRCULATE FOR TOOH TO LD DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

11:30 14:30 3.0 2283 2283 TOOH, W/PIPE SPINNERS AND LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

14:30 17:30 3.0 2283 2283 PU TRI CONE BIT, ROLLER REAMER AND TIH.

17:30 19:00 1.5 2283 2283 CIRCULATE AND ROTATE TO CLEAN HOLE FOR CASING. SPOT 50 BBL. 11.7 PPG. MUD ON
BOTTOM.

19:00 21:00 2.0 2283 2283 TRIP OUT FOR 9 5/8" CASING, LD 8" BHA AND 9 STANDS DP.
-

21:00 02:30 5.5 2283 2283 PJSM W/WEATHERFORD,RUN 55 JTS (2276.67') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#, K-55, ST&C CASING WITH
HALLIBURTON FLOAT SHOE AND FLOAT COLLAR. 12 CENTRALIZERS SPACED 10'FROM THE
SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2 AND #3 THEN EVERY 5TH COLLAR TO SURFACE. ALSO 2
CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @2222.71' TVD / 2273.67' MD. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM,
INCLUDING 10' OF RATHOLE W/TAG JOINT. NO RETURNS WHEN CIRCULATING AT CASING
POINT. PREASURE BUILT TO 120 PSI, THEN DROPPED TO 35 PSI. NO RETURNS. PUMPED 200
BBL. TO CLEAR

FLOATS.¯
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

02:30 06:00 3.5 2283 2283 PJSM W/HALLIBURTON, TEST LINES TO 5000 PSI. PUMPED 20 BBLS GEL/ WATER FLUSH AHEAD
OF CEMENT. LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (182 BBLS) OF HES VARICEM LEAD
CEMENT WITH 0.3% VERSASET, 2% CAL−SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @
10.5 PPG WITH YIELD OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63 BBLS) OF HES
HALCEM CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2 MIXED @ 15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.18 CF/SX. WASHED UP
ON PLUG. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH 172 BBLS FRESH WATER. FINAL PSI 450, BUMPED PLUG
WITH 500 PSI. OVER @ 04:40 AM ON 03/30/12. FLOATS HELD. REGAINED RETURNS @ 134 BBL
DISPLACEMENT AWAY (DLRG FLUID). NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. CALCULATED FINAL PSI=539
PSI. RUNNING 200’ OF 1" PIPE FOR TOP OUTSIDE JOB #1 AT REPORT TIME. DETAILS TO FOLLOW. 





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING:  TRIPPING., RUNNING CASING.


FUEL: 4104 GALS., USED 912 GALS


BILL SNAPP NOTIFIED BLM/VERNAL AND CAROL DANIELS/UDOGM/SALT LAKE OF UPCOMING
SURFACE CASING JOB. @ 14:00 HRS. 3/29/12 VIA E−MAILED BLM FORM AT 21:00 HRS. 03/28/12.

03−31−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $61,974 Completion $0 Daily Total $61,974

Cum Costs: Drilling $314,414 Completion $0 Well Total $314,414

MD 2,365 TVD 2,318 Progress 82 Days 4 MW 10.4 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DLILLING @ 2365’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 2283 2283 TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 60’ OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15.4 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL.

07:00 09:00 2.0 2283 2283 WAIT ON CEMENT.

09:00 13:00 4.0 2283 2283 CUT OFF AND WELD ON HEAD, GOOD CEMENT STILL @ SURFACE.

13:00 17:00 4.0 2283 2283 NU BOP.

17:00 22:00 5.0 2283 2283 TEST UPPER & LOWER  KELLY VALVES, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE VALVES, CHOKE MANIFOLD,
CHECK VALVE, PIPE RAMS & BLIND RAMS TO 5000 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, ANNULAR 2500 PSI
HIGH, 250 LOW.

22:00 22:30 0.5 2283 2283 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.

22:30 23:30 1.0 2283 2283 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND BHA.

23:30 01:30 2.0 2283 2283 TRIP IN HOLE.

01:30 02:30 1.0 2283 2283 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

02:30 03:00 0.5 2283 2283 TIH, TAG CEMENT @ 2216’.

03:00 04:00 1.0 2283 2283 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP.

04:00 04:30 0.5 2283 2293 DRILLED 10’ OF NEW HOLE TO 2293’.

04:30 05:00 0.5 2293 2293 FIT TO 203 PSI W10.3 PPG MUD WT.= 12 PPG EQUIVILANT MW.

05:00 06:00 1.0 2293 2365 ROTATE & SLIDE 2293’ TO 2365’= 72’, ROP 72 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 1650 PSI,
DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE@ 2325’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING:  TEST BOP, DRLG OUT CEMENT..
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Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

02:30 06:00 3.5 2283 2283 PJSM W/HALLIBURTON, TEST LINES TO 5000 PSI. PUMPED 20 BBLS GEL/ WATER FLUSH AHEAD
OF CEMENT. LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (182 BBLS) OF HES VARICEM LEAD
CEMENT WITH 0.3% VERSASET, 2% CAL-SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @
10.5 PPG WITH YIELD OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63 BBLS) OF HES
HALCEM CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2 MIXED @15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.18 CF/SX. WASHED UP
ON PLUG. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH 172 BBLS FRESH WATER. FINAL PSI 450, BUMPED PLUG
WITH 500 PSI. OVER @04:40 AM ON 03/30/12. FLOATS HELD. REGAINED RETURNS @134 BBL
DISPLACEMENT AWAY (DLRG FLUID). NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. CALCULATED FINAL PSI=539

PSI. RUNNING 200' OF 1" PIPE FOR TOP OUTSIDE JOB #1 AT REPORT TIME. DETAILS TO FOLLOW.

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: TRIPPING., RUNNING CASING.1

FUEL: 4104 GALS., USED 912 GALSI

BILL SNAPP NOTIFIED BLM/VERNAL AND CAROL DANIELS/UDOGM/SALT LAKE OF UPCOMING
SURFACE CASING JOB. @14:00 HRS. 3/29/12 VIA E-MAILED BLM FORM AT 21:00 HRS. 03/28/12.

03-31-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $61,974 Completion $0 Daily Total $61,974

Cum Costs: Drilling $314,414 Completion $0 Well Total $314,414

MD 2,365 TVD 2,318 Progress 82 Days 4 MW 10.4 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DLILLING @2365'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 2283 2283 TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 60' OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15.4 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL.

07:00 09:00 2.0 2283 2283 WAIT ON CEMENT.

09:00 13:00 4.0 2283 2283 CUT OFF AND WELD ON HEAD, GOOD CEMENT STILL @SURFACE.

13:00 17:00 4.0 2283 2283 NU BOP.

17:00 22:00 5.0 2283 2283 TEST UPPER & LOWER KELLY VALVES, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE VALVES, CHOKE MANIFOLD,
CHECK VALVE, PIPE RAMS & BLIND RAMS TO 5000 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, ANNULAR 2500 PSI
HIGH, 250 LOW.

22:00 22:30 0.5 2283 2283 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.

22:30 23:30 1.0 2283 2283 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND BHA.

23:30 01:30 2.0 2283 2283 TRIP IN HOLE.

01:30 02:30 1.0 2283 2283 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

02:30 03:00 0.5 2283 2283 TIH, TAG CEMENT @2216'.

03:00 04:00 1.0 2283 2283 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP.

04:00 04:30 0.5 2283 2293 DRILLED 10' OF NEW HOLE TO 2293'.

04:30 05:00 0.5 2293 2293 FIT TO 203 PSI W10.3 PPG MUD WT.= 12 PPG EQUIVILANT MW.

05:00 06:00 1.0 2293 2365 ROTATE & SLIDE 2293' TO 2365'= 72', ROP 72 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 1650 PSI,
DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE@ 2325'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: TEST BOP, DRLG OUT CEMENT..I
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

FUEL: 3762 GALS., USED 342 GALS

04−01−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $96,719 Completion $0 Daily Total $96,719

Cum Costs: Drilling $411,133 Completion $0 Well Total $411,133

MD 4,485 TVD 4,425 Progress 2,120 Days 5 MW 10.3 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 4485’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 2365 3081 ROTATE & SLIDE 2365’ TO 3081’= 716’, ROP 102 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 1650
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 92.5% ROTATE, 7.5% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE@ 2325’.

13:00 13:30 0.5 3081 3081 SERVICE RIG.

13:30 06:00 16.5 3081 4485 ROTATE & SLIDE 3081’ TO 4485’= 1404’, ROP 85 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 92.4% ROTATE, 7.6% SLIDE.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: HOUSE KEEPING, WORKING W/ELECTRICITY.


FUEL: 6840 GALS., USED 1422 GALS  RCVD−4500 GAL.

04−02−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,241 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,241

Cum Costs: Drilling $446,374 Completion $0 Well Total $446,374

MD 6,085 TVD 6,025 Progress 1,600 Days 6 MW 10.5 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 6085’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 4485 5171 ROTATE & SLIDE 4485’ TO 5171’= 686’, ROP 76 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 2150 PSI,
DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 97.8 ROTATE, 2.2% SLIDE. WASATCH@ 4681’.

15:00 15:30 0.5 5171 5171 SERVICE RIG.

15:30 06:00 14.5 5171 6085 ROTATE & SLIDE 5171’ TO 6085’= 914’, ROP 63 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 2350 PSI,
DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 97.7% ROTATE, 2.3% SLIDE. CHAPITA WELLS@ 5271’, BUCK CANYON@
5870’. LOST 60 BBL MUD@ 5367’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: HORSE PLAY, DRIVING TO/FROM WORK.


FUEL: 5130 GALS., USED 1710 GALS.

04−03−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $50,355 Completion $0 Daily Total $50,355

Cum Costs: Drilling $496,730 Completion $0 Well Total $496,730

MD 7,065 TVD 7,005 Progress 980 Days 7 MW 11.0 Visc 35.0
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Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

FUEL: 3762 GALS., USED 342 GALS

04-01-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $96,719 Completion $0 Daily Total $96,719

Cum Costs: Drilling $411,133 Completion $0 Well Total $411,133

MD 4,485 TVD 4,425 Progress 2,120 Days 5 MW 10.3 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @4485'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 2365 3081 ROTATE & SLIDE 2365' TO 3081'= 716', ROP 102 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 1650
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 92.5% ROTATE, 7.5% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE@ 2325'.

13:00 13:30 0.5 3081 3081 SERVICE RIG.

13:30 06:00 16.5 3081 4485 ROTATE & SLIDE 3081' TO 4485'= 1404', ROP 85 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 92.4% ROTATE, 7.6% SLIDE.1

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS I

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSE KEEPING, WORKING W/ELECTRICITY.1

FUEL: 6840 GALS., USED 1422 GALS RCVD-4500 GAL.

04-02-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,241 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,241

Cum Costs: Drilling $446,374 Completion $0 Well Total $446,374

MD 6,085 TVD 6,025 Progress 1,600 Days 6 MW 10.5 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @6085'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 4485 5171 ROTATE & SLIDE 4485' TO 5171'= 686', ROP 76 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 2150 PSI,
DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 97.8 ROTATE, 2.2% SLIDE. WASATCH@ 4681'.

15:00 15:30 0.5 5171 5171 SERVICE RIG.

15:30 06:00 14.5 5171 6085 ROTATE & SLIDE 5171' TO 6085'= 914', ROP 63 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 2350 PSI,
DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 97.7% ROTATE, 2.3% SLIDE. CHAPITA WELLS@ 5271', BUCK CANYON@
5870'. LOST 60 BBL MUD@ 5367'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS I

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: HORSE PLAY, DRIVING TO/FROM WORK.1

FUEL: 5130 GALS., USED 1710 GALS.

04-03-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $50,355 Completion $0 Daily Total $50,355

Cum Costs: Drilling $496,730 Completion $0 Well Total $496,730

MD 7,065 TVD 7,005 Progress 980 Days 7 MW 11.0 Visc 35.0
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 7065’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 6085 6519 ROTATE & SLIDE 6085’ TO 6519’= 434’, ROP 45.7 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73,  SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 96.5% ROTATE, 3.5% SLIDE. 

15:30 16:00 0.5 6519 6519 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 6519 7065 ROTATE & SLIDE 6519’ TO 7065’= 546’, ROP 39 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 70,  SPP 2390 PSI,
DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE. NORTH HORN@ 6642’, PRICE RIVER TOP@
6997’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: KEEPING AIR PSI TO RIG, INSPECTING PPE.


FUEL: 3420 GALS., USED 1710 GALS.

04−04−2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $65,681 Completion $6,668 Daily Total $72,349

Cum Costs: Drilling $562,411 Completion $6,668 Well Total $569,079

MD 8,000 TVD 7,940 Progress 935 Days 8 MW 11.2 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 8000’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 7065 7358 ROTATE & SLIDE 7065’ TO 7358’= 293’, ROP 30.8 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 70,  SPP 2390
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE. 

15:30 16:00 0.5 7358 7358 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 7358 8000 ROTATE & SLIDE 7358’ TO 8000’= 642’, ROP 45.8 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 67,  SPP 2500
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE@ 7869’. LOST 110
BBL. MUD@ 7260’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: WORKING W/POWER CORDS, FORKLIFT OPERATION.


FUEL: 5814 GALS., USED 1806 GALS. RCVD 4200 GAL.

04−05−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER/BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $43,173 Completion $0 Daily Total $43,173

Cum Costs: Drilling $605,584 Completion $6,668 Well Total $612,252

MD 8,940 TVD 8,873 Progress 940 Days 9 MW 11.5 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 8940’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @7065'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 6085 6519 ROTATE & SLIDE 6085' TO 6519'= 434', ROP 45.7 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 73, SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 96.5% ROTATE, 3.5% SLIDE.

15:30 16:00 0.5 6519 6519 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 6519 7065 ROTATE & SLIDE 6519' TO 7065'= 546', ROP 39 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 70, SPP 2390 PSI,
DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE. NORTH HORN@ 6642', PRICE RIVER TOP@
6997'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS I

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: KEEPING AIR PSI TO RIG, INSPECTING PPE.1

FUEL: 3420 GALS., USED 1710 GALS.

04-04-2012 Reported By BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $65,681 Completion $6,668 Daily Total $72,349

Cum Costs: Drilling $562,411 Completion $6,668 Well Total $569,079

MD 8,000 TVD 7,940 Progress 935 Days 8 MW 11.2 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @8000'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 7065 7358 ROTATE & SLIDE 7065' TO 7358'= 293', ROP 30.8 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 70, SPP 2390
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE.

15:30 16:00 0.5 7358 7358 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 7358 8000 ROTATE & SLIDE 7358' TO 8000'= 642', ROP 45.8 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 67, SPP 2500
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 461 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE@ 7869'. LOST 110
BBL. MUD@ 7260'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS I

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: WORKING W/POWER CORDS, FORKLIFT OPERATION.1

FUEL: 5814 GALS., USED 1806 GALS. RCVD 4200 GAL.

04-05-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER/BILL SNAPP

DailyCosts: Drilling $43,173 Completion $0 Daily Total $43,173

Cum Costs: Drilling $605,584 Completion $6,668 Well Total $612,252

MD 8,940 TVD 8,873 Progress 940 Days 9 MW 11.5 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @8940'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 12:30 6.5 8000 8262 ROTATE & SLIDE 8000’ TO 8262’’= 262’, ROP 40.3 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 63,  SPP 2225
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 418 GPM. 95% ROTATE, 5% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7869’, PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8658’.

12:30 13:00 0.5 8262 8262 SERVICE RIG.

13:00 06:00 17.0 8262 8940 ROTATE & SLIDE 8262’ TO 8940’= 678’, ROP 39.9 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 63,  SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 418 GPM. 95.5% ROTATE, 4.5% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE@ 7869’, PRICE
RIVER 8658, SEGO 9164’.





NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING: WORKING W/ 3RD PERSONAL, PROPER CLOTHING


FUEL: 4332 GAL., USED 1482 GALS.

04−06−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,945 Completion $0 Daily Total $39,945

Cum Costs: Drilling $645,530 Completion $6,668 Well Total $652,198

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 435 Days 10 MW 11.8 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TIH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 8940 9293 ROTATE & SLIDE 8940’ TO 9293’= 353’, ROP 39.2 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 60,  SPP 2400
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 400 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 8658, SEGO 9164’.

15:00 15:30 0.5 9293 9293 SERVICE RIG.

15:30 18:30 3.0 9293 9375 ROTATE & SLIDE 9293’ TO 9375’= 82’, ROP 27.3 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/60, MM 60,  SPP 2400
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 400 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, SEGO 9164’. REACHED TD AT @ 18:30 HRS,
4/5/2012.





18:30 21:30 3.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, CHECK FLOW.

21:30 04:30 7.0 9375 9375 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR WIPER TRIP. WORK TIGHT HOLE 7240’ TO 7200’, 5240’ TO 5220’, 4660’ TO
4550’.

04:30 05:30 1.0 9375 9375 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

05:30 06:00 0.5 9375 9375 MAKE UP BIT SUB & BIT & TRIP IN HOLE.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, USING MAN BASKET, WORKING IN HIGH WINDS


COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPING


FUEL 2850 GALS., USED 1482 GALS.

04−07−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,991 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,991

Cum Costs: Drilling $687,521 Completion $6,668 Well Total $694,189

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 12.1 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN 4.5" CASING

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 12:30 6.5 8000 8262 ROTATE & SLIDE 8000' TO 8262"= 262', ROP 40.3 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 63, SPP 2225
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 418 GPM. 95% ROTATE, 5% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7869', PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8658'.

12:30 13:00 0.5 8262 8262 SERVICE RIG.

13:00 06:00 17.0 8262 8940 ROTATE & SLIDE 8262' TO 8940'= 678', ROP 39.9 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 63, SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 418 GPM. 95.5% ROTATE, 4.5% SLIDE. PRICE RIVER MIDDLE@ 7869', PRICE
RIVER 8658, SEGO 9164'.I

NO INCIDENT, NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

BOP DRILL: BOTH CREWS I

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING: WORKING W/ 3RD PERSONAL, PROPER CLOTHINGT

FUEL: 4332 GAL., USED 1482 GALS.

04-06-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,945 Completion $0 Daily Total $39,945

Cum Costs: Drilling $645,530 Completion $6,668 Well Total $652,198

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 435 Days 10 MW 11.8 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TIH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 8940 9293 ROTATE & SLIDE 8940' TO 9293'= 353', ROP 39.2 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 60, SPP 2400
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 400 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 8658, SEGO 9164'.

15:00 15:30 0.5 9293 9293 SERVICE RIG.

15:30 18:30 3.0 9293 9375 ROTATE & SLIDE 9293' TO 9375'= 82', ROP 27.3 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/60, MM 60, SPP 2400
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 400 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, SEGO 9164'. REACHED TD AT @18:30 HRS,
4/5/2012.1

18:30 21:30 3.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, CHECK FLOW.

21:30 04:30 7.0 9375 9375 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR WIPER TRIP. WORK TIGHT HOLE 7240' TO 7200', 5240' TO 5220', 4660' TO
4550'.

04:30 05:30 1.0 9375 9375 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

05:30 06:00 0.5 9375 9375 MAKE UP BIT SUB & BIT & TRIP IN HOLE.1

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, USING MAN BASKET, WORKING IN HIGH WINDS I

COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPINGT

FUEL 2850 GALS., USED 1482 GALS.

04-07-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,991 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,991

Cum Costs: Drilling $687,521 Completion $6,668 Well Total $694,189

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 12.1 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN 4.5" CASING

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 08:00 2.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE, TAG BRIDGE @ 4612’.

08:00 09:00 1.0 9375 9375 PICK UP KELLY & WASH THRU BRIDGE

09:00 10:00 1.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE, TAG BRIDGE @ 7024’.

10:00 11:30 1.5 9375 9375 PICK UP KELLY & WASH THRU BRIDGE, LOST 150 BBLS OF MUD.

11:30 13:00 1.5 9375 9375 CIRCULATE, & BUILD VOLUME.

13:00 14:00 1.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE.

14:00 14:30 0.5 9375 9375 WASH/REAM 100’ TO BOTTOM, 8’ OF FILL.

14:30 16:30 2.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE & CONDITION HOLE ON BOTTOM.10’ TO 15’ FLARE  FOR 30MIN.

16:30 21:30 5.0 9375 9375 HOLD PJSM W/ FRANKS & LAY DOWN DRILLPIPE.

21:30 22:00 0.5 9375 9375 BREAK KELLY, PULL DRIVE BUSHING & ROTATING RUBBER.

22:00 23:00 1.0 9375 9375 LAY DOWN BHA.

23:00 23:30 0.5 9375 9375 PULL WEAR BUSHING.

23:30 06:00 6.5 9375 9375 HOLD PJSM W/ FRANKS, RIG UP CASERS & RUN 4.5" CASING. CASING DETAILS TO FOLLOW ON
TOMORROWS REPORT.  SHOE AT 6100’ AT REPORT TIME.  





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, LAYING DOWN D.P., RUNNING CASING


COM CHECK TRIPPING


FUEL, 2166 GALS., USED 684 GALS.

04−08−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $76,811 Completion $169,222 Daily Total $246,034

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $175,890 Well Total $940,223

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 12.0 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 08:30 2.5 9375 9375 RUN TOTAL OF 226 JTS OF CASING ( 224 FULL JTS  OF 4.5", 11.6#, N−80, LT&C + 2 MARKER
JOINTS 11.6#, P−110, LT&C) AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, 56 JTS OF
CASING, MARKER JOINT, @ TOP OF PRICE RIVER, 65 JTS, CASING, MARKER JOINT, @ 400’
ABOVE WASATCH, 102 JTS CASING. RAN 3 TURBILIZERS (5’ ABOVE SHOE AND MIDDLE OF JTS
#2 & #3) + 1 BOW CENTRALIZER EVERY 3RD JOINT THEREAFTER TO 400’ ABOVE WASATCH
(TOTAL OF 40) TAG BOTTOM , LAY DOWN TAG JOINT, PICK UP MANDREL & LAND CASING W/
80K STRING WEIGHT @ 9375’. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM W/ NO HOLE PROBLEMS.





CASING LANDED AS FOLLOWS (DEPTHS SHOWN ARE TOPS OF 


COMPONENTS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED):


FLOAT SHOE (BOTTOM): 9369’


FLOAT COLLAR: 9325’


MARKER JOINT: 6986’


MARKER JOINT: 4270’





08:30 11:30 3.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE CASING ON BOTTOM, LAST 200 BBLS W/ 0.5 GPT ALDICIDE. NO FLARE. 
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Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 08:00 2.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE, TAG BRIDGE @4612'.

08:00 09:00 1.0 9375 9375 PICK UP KELLY & WASH THRU BRIDGE

09:00 10:00 1.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE, TAG BRIDGE @7024'.

10:00 11:30 1.5 9375 9375 PICK UP KELLY & WASH THRU BRIDGE, LOST 150 BBLS OF MUD.

11:30 13:00 1.5 9375 9375 CIRCULATE, & BUILD VOLUME.

13:00 14:00 1.0 9375 9375 TRIP IN HOLE.

14:00 14:30 0.5 9375 9375 WASH/REAM 100' TO BOTTOM, 8' OF FILL.

14:30 16:30 2.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE & CONDITION HOLE ON BOTTOM.10' TO 15'FLARE FOR 30MIN.

16:30 21:30 5.0 9375 9375 HOLD PJSM W/ FRANKS & LAY DOWN DRILLPIPE.

21:30 22:00 0.5 9375 9375 BREAK KELLY, PULL DRIVE BUSHING & ROTATING RUBBER.

22:00 23:00 1.0 9375 9375 LAY DOWN BHA.

23:00 23:30 0.5 9375 9375 PULL WEAR BUSHING.

23:30 06:00 6.5 9375 9375 HOLD PJSM W/ FRANKS, RIG UP CASERS & RUN 4.5" CASING. CASING DETAILS TO FOLLOW ON
TOMORROWS REPORT. SHOE AT 6100' AT REPORT TIME. I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, LAYING DOWN D.P., RUNNING CASINGT

COM CHECK TRIPPINGT

FUEL, 2166 GALS., USED 684 GALS.

04-08-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $76,811 Completion $169,222 Daily Total $246,034

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $175,890 Well Total $940,223

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 12.0 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 08:30 2.5 9375 9375 RUN TOTAL OF 226 JTS OF CASING ( 224 FULL JTS OF 4.5", 11.6#, N-80, LT&C + 2 MARKER
JOINTS 11.6#, P-110, LT&C) AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, 56 JTS OF
CASING, MARKER JOINT, @TOP OF PRICE RIVER, 65 JTS, CASING, MARKER JOINT, @400'
ABOVE WASATCH, 102 JTS CASING. RAN 3 TURBILIZERS (5'ABOVE SHOE AND MIDDLE OF JTS
#2 & #3) + 1 BOW CENTRALIZER EVERY 3RD JOINT THEREAFTER TO 400'ABOVE WASATCH
(TOTAL OF 40) TAG BOTTOM , LAY DOWN TAG JOINT, PICK UP MANDREL & LAND CASING W/
80K STRING WEIGHT @9375'. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM W/ NO HOLE PROBLEMS.I

CASING LANDED AS FOLLOWS (DEPTHS SHOWN ARE TOPS OF I

COMPONENTS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED):I

FLOAT SHOE (BOTTOM): 9369'l

FLOAT COLLAR: 9325'l

MARKER JOINT: 6986'l

MARKER JOINT: 4270'l

08:30 11:30 3.0 9375 9375 CIRCULATE CASING ON BOTTOM, LAST 200 BBLS W/ 0.5 GPT ALDICIDE. NO FLARE.
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

11:30 14:00 2.5 9375 9375 TEST LINE TO 5000#, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH WATER
W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 510 SKS (144 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61 YIELD W/ 4% BENTONITE, 0.3%
VERSASET, 0.5% HR−5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1345 SKS (352 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47 YIELD W/ 0.125
LBM POLY−E−FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 144.5 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5 GPT
MYACIDE, DISPLACED @ 8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 3 BBLS MIN W/ 137BBLS GONE, FCP 2313#,
BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3500#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT,  FLOATS HELD. FULL
RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB.





14:00 15:00 1.0 9375 9375 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# ON CASING & HOLD FOR 1 HOUR.

15:00 16:00 1.0 9375 9375 REMOVE CEMENT HEAD, LANDING JOINT, INSTALL PACK OFF & TEST TO 5000#.

16:00 18:00 2.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN & CLEAN MUD TANKS.  RELEASE RIG @ 18:00, 4/7/2012.

18:00 06:00 12.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN, & PREPARE FOR TRUCKS.





NO INCICENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING  CEMENTING & RIGGING DOWN


FUEL 1824 GALS., USED 342 GALS.


TRANSFERED 1824 GALS TO CWU 1206−14





06:00 0 0 RELEASED RIG @ 18:00 HRS, 4/7/12.


CASING POINT COST $752,075

04−13−2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $16,000 Daily Total $16,000

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $191,890 Well Total $956,223

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. LOG WITH CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FORM 9317’ TO 70’. EST CEMENT TOP
@ 750’. RDWL.

05−12−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $258 Daily Total $258

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $192,148 Well Total $956,481

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8963’−9129’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 FRAC TANKS PRE MIXED W/BIOCIDE (BE 6) @ 3# PER TANK.





STAGE 1. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE & MIRU HALLIBURTON, PERFORATE LPR FROM 9128’−29’,
9119’−20’, 9094’−95’, 9087’−88’, 9066’−67’, 9058’−59’, 9048’−49’, 9032’−33’, 9025’−26’, 9011’−12’,
9002’−03’, 8963’−64’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL
OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO
6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON
KW31 @ 2GPT), 618 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7660 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9900# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5
PPG, 23366 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/78800# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 6020 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM.
ATP 4420 PSIG. ATR 50 BPM. ISIP 2964 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.
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Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

11:30 14:00 2.5 9375 9375 TEST LINE TO 5000#, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH WATER
W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 510 SKS (144 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61YIELD W/ 4% BENTONITE, 0.3%
VERSASET, 0.5% HR-5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1345 SKS (352 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47YIELD W/ 0.125
LBM POLY-E-FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 144.5 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5 GPT
MYACIDE, DISPLACED @8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 3 BBLS MIN W/ 137BBLS GONE, FCP 2313#,
BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3500#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT, FLOATS HELD. FULL
RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB.1

14:00 15:00 1.0 9375 9375 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# ON CASING & HOLD FOR 1 HOUR.

15:00 16:00 1.0 9375 9375 REMOVE CEMENT HEAD, LANDING JOINT, INSTALL PACK OFF & TEST TO 5000#.

16:00 18:00 2.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN & CLEAN MUD TANKS. RELEASE RIG @18:00, 4/7/2012.

18:00 06:00 12.0 9375 9375 RIG DOWN, & PREPARE FOR TRUCKS.I

NO INCICENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING CEMENTING & RIGGING DOWNT

FUEL 1824 GALS., USED 342 GALS.I

TRANSFERED 1824 GALS TO CWU 1206-141

06:00 0 0 RELEASED RIG @18:00 HRS, 4/7/12.1

CASING POINT COST $752,075

04-13-2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $16,000 Daily Total $16,000

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $191,890 Well Total $956,223

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. LOG WITH CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FORM 9317' TO 70'. EST CEMENT TOP

@750'. RDWL.

05-12-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $258 Daily Total $258

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $192,148 Well Total $956,481

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8963'-9129' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 FRAC TANKS PRE MIXED W/BIOCIDE (BE 6) @3# PER
TANK.¯

STAGE 1. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE & MIRU HALLIBURTON, PERFORATE LPR FROM 9128'-29',
9119'-20', 9094'-95', 9087'-88', 9066'-67', 9058'-59', 9048'-49', 9032'-33', 9025'-26', 901l'-12',
9002'-03', 8963'-64' @3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL
OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO
6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON
KW31 @2GPT), 618 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7660 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9900# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5

PPG, 23366 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/78800# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 6020 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM.
ATP 4420 PSIG. ATR 50 BPM. ISIP 2964 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

Page 9

RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

05−13−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $258 Daily Total $258

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $192,406 Well Total $956,739

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8552’−9129’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 STAGE 2. SICP 1770 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8946’. PERFORATE LPR FROM 8924’−25’,
8918’−19’, 8899’−8900’, 8890’−91’, 8882’−83’, 8856’−57’, 8828’−29’, 8814’−15’, 8799’−8800’, 8782’−83’,
8778’−79’, 8769’−70’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31
@ 2GPT). 935 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7518 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9700# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG,
4565 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/6800# 20/40 SAND @ 2−3 PPG.WENT TO FLUSH. GEL UNIT BLEW OUT
A COOLANT HOSE. OVER FLUSHED 30 BBLS.  REPAIRED GEL UNIT. 


RESUMED STAGE 2 . 1785 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 22967 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/75500# 20/40 SAND
@ 2−4 PPG.  MTP 5500 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 4324 PSIG. ATR 48.7 BPM. ISIP 3321 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 3. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8754’. PERFORATE MPR/LPR FROM 8736’−37’, 8727’−28’,
8719’−20’, 8690’−91’, 8678’−79’, 8669’−70’, 8637’−38’, 8626’−27’, 8588’−89’, 8575’−76’, 8560’−61’,
8552’−53’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC
6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106 PLUS 5
BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT),
791 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7586 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9800# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 34401 GAL
16# DELTA 200 W/111600# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5905 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 5149 PSIG.
ATR 47.4 BPM. ISIP 3629 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05−14−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $387,058 Daily Total $387,058

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $579,464 Well Total $1,343,797

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036’−9129’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU CLEAN OUT SAND AND DRILL OUT FRAC PLUGS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 0 0 STAGE 4. INTIAL PRESSUER 1799 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8548’. PERFORATE MPR FROM
8518’−19’, 8514’−15’, 8503’−04’, 8496’−97’, 8488’−89’, 8470’−71’, 8464’−65’, 8454’−55’, 8433’−34’,
8426’−27’, 8401’−02’, 8394’−95’@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD
PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55
GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL
BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 704 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7420 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500#
20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 33064 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/110500# 20/40 SAND @ 2−4 PPG. MTP 5694
PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4494 PSIG. ATR 49.3 BPM. ISIP 3077 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 5. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8378’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8358’−59’, 8342’−43’, 8329’−30’,
8320’−21’, 8308’−09’, 8287’−88’, 8278’−79’, 8262’−63’, 8254’−55’, 8245’−46’, 8221’−22’, 8208’−09’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 846
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7415 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 41383 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/143200# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5732 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4051 PSIG. ATR
49.7 BPM. ISIP 2622 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

05-13-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $258 Daily Total $258

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $192,406 Well Total $956,739

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8552'-9129' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 STAGE 2. SICP 1770 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8946'. PERFORATE LPR FROM 8924'-25',
8918'-19', 8899'-8900', 8890'-91', 8882'-83', 8856'-57', 8828'-29', 8814'-15', 8799'-8800', 8782'-83',
8778'-79', 8769'-70' @3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31

@2GPT). 935 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7518 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9700# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG,
4565 GAL 16#DELTA 200 W/6800# 20/40 SAND @2-3 PPG.WENT TO FLUSH. GEL UNIT BLEW OUT
A COOLANT HOSE. OVER FLUSHED 30 BBLS. REPAIRED GEL UNIT.

-

RESUMED STAGE 2 . 1785 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 22967 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/75500# 20/40 SAND

@2-4 PPG. MTP 5500 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 4324 PSIG. ATR 48.7 BPM. ISIP 3321 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 3. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8754'. PERFORATE MPR/LPR FROM 8736'-37', 8727'-28',
8719'-20', 8690'-91', 8678'-79', 8669'-70', 8637'-38', 8626'-27', 8588'-89', 8575'-76', 8560'-61',
8552'-53' @3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC
6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106 PLUS 5
BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT),
791 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7586 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9800# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 34401 GAL
16# DELTA 200 W/lll600# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5905 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 5149 PSIG.
ATR 47.4 BPM. ISIP 3629 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05-14-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $387,058 Daily Total $387,058

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $579,464 Well Total $1,343,797

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036'-9129' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU CLEAN OUT SAND AND DRILL OUT FRAC PLUGS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 0 0 STAGE 4. INTIAL PRESSUER 1799 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8548'. PERFORATE MPR FROM
8518'-19', 8514'-15', 8503'-04', 8496'-97', 8488'-89', 8470'-71', 8464'-65', 8454'-55', 8433'-34',
8426'-27', 8401'-02', 8394'-95'@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD
PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55
GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL
BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 704 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7420 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500#
20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 33064 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/110500# 20/40 SAND @2-4 PPG. MTP 5694
PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4494 PSIG. ATR 49.3 BPM. ISIP 3077 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 5. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8378'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8358'-59', 8342'-43', 8329'-30',
8320'-21', 8308'-09', 8287'-88', 8278'-79', 8262'-63', 8254'-55', 8245'-46', 8221'-22', 8208'-09'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 846
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7415 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 41383 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/143200# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5732 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4051 PSIG. ATR
49.7 BPM. ISIP 2622 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

STAGE 6. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8188’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8168’−69’, 8137’−38’, 8128’−29’,
8120’−21’, 8114’−15’, 8101’−02’, 8091’−92’, 8068’−69’, 8058’−59’, 8047’−48’, 8027’−28’, 8016’−17’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE
INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH
WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 580 GAL 16#
LINEAR PAD,  7412 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 40044 GAL 16# DELTA 200
W/138300# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 4931 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 3912 PSIG. ATR 49.9 BPM.
ISIP 2718 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 7. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7998’. PERFORATE UPR/MPR FROM 7980’−81’, 7963’−64’,
7951’−52’, 7940’−41’, 7897’−98’, 7887’−88’, 7872’−73’, 7857’−58’, 7850’−51’, 7820’−21’, 7797’−98’,
7787’−88’@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO
EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5
BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT),
720 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7415 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 27550 GAL
16# DELTA 200 W/96000# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 6076 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 5045 PSIG.
ATR 46.5 BPM. ISIP 2617 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.

12:00 06:00 18.0 0 0 STAGE 8. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7770’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7747’−48’, 7723’−24’, 7706’−07’,
7698’−99’, 7681’−82’, 7620’−21’, 7588’−89’, 7576’−77’, 7566’−67’, 7552’−53’, 7515’−16’, 7510’−11’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 950
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7422 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 28051 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/95500# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 6158 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 4917 PSIG. ATR
45.1 BPM. ISIP 2527 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 9. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7488’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7468’−69’, 7461’−62’, 7448’−49’,
7442’−43’, 7393’−94’, 7386’−87’, 7371’−72’, 7360’−61’, 7353’−54’, 7320’−21’, 7287’−88’, 7261’−62’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 1744
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7321 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9400# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 34077 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/111500# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 6879 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4488 PSIG. ATR
48.8 BPM. ISIP 2338 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 10. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7242’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7222’−23’, 7205’−06’, 7178’−79’,
7155’−56’, 7136’−37’, 7122’−23’, 7108’−09’, 7088’−89’, 7074’−75’,7062’−63’, 7044’−45’, 7036’−37’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 387
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7410 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 49811 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/178300# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 4944 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 2991 PSIG. ATR
49.9 BPM. ISIP 1800 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 6986’. BLED WELL TO 0 PSIG. RDMO CUTTERS WIRELINE &
HALIBURTON SERVICES. SWIFN.

05−19−2012 Reported By BASTIAN / BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $76,210 Daily Total $76,210

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $655,674 Well Total $1,420,007

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036’−9129’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

STAGE 6. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8188'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8168'-69', 8137'-38', 8128'-29',
8120'-21', 8114'-15', 8101'-02', 8091'-92', 8068'-69', 8058'-59', 8047'-48', 8027'-28', 8016'-17'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE
INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH
WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 580 GAL 16#
LINEAR PAD, 7412 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 40044 GAL 16# DELTA 200
W/138300# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 4931 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 3912 PSIG. ATR 49.9 BPM.
ISIP 2718 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 7. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7998'. PERFORATE UPR/MPR FROM 7980'-81', 7963'-64',
7951'-52', 7940'-41', 7897'-98', 7887'-88', 7872'-73', 7857'-58', 7850'-51', 7820'-21', 7797'-98',
7787'-88'@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO
EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5
BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT),
720 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7415 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 27550 GAL
16# DELTA 200 W/96000# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 6076 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 5045 PSIG.
ATR 46.5 BPM. ISIP 2617 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.

12:00 06:00 18.0 0 0 STAGE 8. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7770'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7747'-48', 7723'-24', 7706'-07',
7698'-99', 7681'-82', 7620'-21', 7588'-89', 7576'-77', 7566'-67', 7552'-53', 7515'-16', 7510'-11'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 950
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7422 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 28051 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/95500# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 6158 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 4917 PSIG. ATR
45.1 BPM. ISIP 2527 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 9. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7488'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7468'-69', 7461'-62', 7448'-49',
7442'-43', 7393'-94', 7386'-87', 7371'-72', 7360'-61', 7353'-54', 7320'-21', 7287'-88', 7261'-62'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 1744
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7321 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9400# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 34077 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/lll500# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 6879 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4488 PSIG. ATR
48.8 BPM. ISIP 2338 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 10. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7242'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7222'-23', 7205'-06', 7178'-79',
7155'-56', 7136'-37', 7122'-23', 7108'-09', 7088'-89', 7074'-75',7062'-63', 7044'-45', 7036'-37'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 387
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7410 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 49811 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/178300# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 4944 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 2991 PSIG. ATR
49.9 BPM. ISIP 1800 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 6986'. BLED WELL TO 0 PSIG. RDMO CUTTERS WIRELINE &
HALIBURTON SERVICES. SWIFN.

05-19-2012 Reported By BASTIAN / BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $76,210 Daily Total $76,210

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $655,674 Well Total $1,420,007

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036'-9129' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1542−26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 MIRU POWELL RIG 1. ND FRAC TREE. NU BOP. RIH W/BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO TAG @ 6986’. RU
TO DRILL PLUGS. TESTED FLOW LINE & BOPE TO 1800 PSI. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT
PLUGS @ 6986’, 7242’, 7488’, 7770’, 7998’, 8188’, 8378’, 8548’, 8754’ & 8946’. CLEAN OUT TO 9231’.
POH, LD EXCESS TBG. LANDED TBG @ 7697’ KB. ND BOP. NU WH. RDMOSU.





TUBING DETAIL				LENGTH





PUMP OFF SUB				1.00’


1 JT 2−3/8 4.7# L−80 TBG			32.98’


XN NIPPLE				1.30’ @ 7662’


234 JTS 2−3/8 4.7# L−80 TBG			7643.18’


BELOW KB				19.00’	


LANDED @				7697.46’ KB 

05−22−2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,625 Daily Total $2,625

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $658,299 Well Total $1,422,632

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036’−9129’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST/INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 RU TEST UNIT. FLOWED THROUGH TEST UNIT 14 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 1150 PSIG, CP 2200
PSIG. 41 BPH, RECOVERED 616 BLW. 11025 BLWTR. 1035 MCFD RATE.





INITIAL PRODUCTION:  TURNED WELL TO QUESTAR SALES AT 10:00 AM, 5/21/12.  FTP 1000
PSIG, FCP 2800 PSIG.  FLOWING 448 MCFD ON 24/64" CK.

05−23−2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,625 Daily Total $2,625

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $660,924 Well Total $1,425,257

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036’−9129’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 FLOWED THROUGH TEST UNIT 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 1050 PSIG, CP 1900 PSIG. 29 BPH,
RECOVERED 702 BLW. 10323 BLWTR. 1352 MCFD RATE.
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Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000Sundry Number: 25982 API Well Number: 43047523950000
Well Name: CWU 1542-26DX Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 090334

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 MIRU POWELL RIG 1. ND FRAC TREE. NU BOP. RIH W/BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO TAG @6986'. RU
TO DRILL PLUGS. TESTED FLOW LINE & BOPE TO 1800 PSI. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT
PLUGS @6986', 7242', 7488', 7770', 7998', 8188', 8378', 8548', 8754' & 8946'. CLEAN OUT TO 9231'.
POH, LD EXCESS TBG. LANDED TBG @7697' KB. ND BOP. NU WH. RDMOSU.1

TUBING DETAIL ]ILENGTH I

PUMP OFF SUB]II.00'l

1 JT 2-3/8 4.7# L-80 TBG]32.98'l

XN NIPPLE]II.30' @7662'l

234 JTS 2-3/8 4.7# L-80 TBG]7643.18'l

BELOW KB Il9.00'

LANDED @ 17697.46' KB

05-22-2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,625 Daily Total $2,625

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $658,299 Well Total $1,422,632

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036'-9129' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST/INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 RU TEST UNIT. FLOWED THROUGH TEST UNIT 14 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 1150 PSIG, CP 2200
PSIG. 41 BPH, RECOVERED 616 BLW. 11025 BLWTR. 1035 MCFD RATE.

INITIAL PRODUCTION: TURNED WELL TO QUESTAR SALES AT 10:00 AM, 5/21/12. FTP 1000
PSIG, FCP 2800 PSIG. FLOWING 448 MCFD ON 24/64" CK.

05-23-2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,625 Daily Total $2,625

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,332 Completion $660,924 Well Total $1,425,257

MD 9,375 TVD 9,315 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7036'-9129' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 FLOWED THROUGH TEST UNIT 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 1050 PSIG, CP 1900 PSIG. 29 BPH,
RECOVERED 702 BLW. 10323 BLWTR. 1352 MCFD RATE.

Page 12

RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECE VED
Form3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(August2007) PEBO 9 2012 OMBNo. 1004-0137

ExpiresJuly31,2010
UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LeaseSerialNo.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT BLM UTUO285A

6. If Indian,Allotee or TribeName
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER

O O 2 If Unitor CAAgreement,NameandNo.
la. Typeofwork: / DRILL REENTER CHAPITA WELLS UNIT

8. Lease NameandWel1No.
lb. Typeof Well: On Wen GasWell Other SingleZone MultipleZone CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1542-26DX

2. Nameof0perator EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API WellNo. g(
43-047-64·748 16 SC

3a. Address 600 17th Street, Suite 1000N 3b. PhoneNo.(include area code) 10. Fieldand Pool,orExploratory
Denver, CO 80202 435-781-9145 NATURAL BUTTES

4. Locationof Well (Report locationclearly and inaccordance with any State requirements.*) 11.Sec.,T. R.M. or Blk.andSurveyorArea

At surface (NENE) 449 FNL, 471 FEL, 40.013006 Lat, 109.399436 Lon SEC 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

At proposed prod.zone Section 25 (NWNW) 659 FNL, 19 FEL, 40.12428 Lat,109.397686 Lon

14. Distancein miles and directionfromnearesttown orpost office* 12.Countyor Parish 13. State
50.8 MILES FROM VERNAL UINTAH UT

15, Distancefromproposed*
19 16. No.of acresin lease 17. SpacingUnitdedicatedto thiswell

locationtonearest 1800
propertyor leaseline,ft.
(Alsotonearestdrig.unit line,if any)

18. Distancefromproposedlocation*
430 19. ProposedDepth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No.onfile

appnl
d for o

td llienas,completed, 9315 TVD, 9367 MD NM2308

21. Elevations(Showwhether DF,KDB,RT,GL,etc.) 22. Approximatedatework will start* 23. Estimatedduration
5015 NAT GL . 45 DAYS

24. Attachments

Thefollowing,completedinaccordancewith the requirements of OnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,mustbe attachedtothis form:

1. Wellplatcertifiedby a registeredsurveyor. 4. Bondto coverthe operationsunlesscoveredby anexistingbond on file (see
1 A DrillingPlan. Item20 above).

3. A SurfaceUse Plan (if the locationis on National Forest SystemLands, the 5. Operatorcertification
SUPO mustbe filedwith the appropriate ForestServiceOffice). 6. Suchothersite specificinformationand/orplansas may be requiredbythe

BLM.

T2 Signature Name (nzrienteGdyeped) DO
/09/2012

Regulatory Assistant

S
Min

RMea
r s

ONf

c

RrNA IncL
OFFICE

FEBi 3 2012

Applicationapprovaldoesnot warrantor certifythattheapplicantholdslegalorequitable titletothoserights inthesubjectleasewhichwouldentitletheapplicantto
c°2"addonpse opnt eonany,

are attached. CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTACHED
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001andTitle43 U.S.C.Section1212,makeit a crimefor any personknowinglyand willfully to maketoany departmentor agency of the United
Statesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as toanymatter within itsjurisdiction.

(Continued on page 2) *(Instructions on page 2)

RECEIVESOTICEOFAPPROVAL
FEB15 2012

Div.0FOIL,GAS&
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' ' UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
**ea a,# 170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: EOG Resources, Inc. Location: NENE, Sec. 26, T9S, R22E
Well No: CWU 1542-26DX Rid Skid Lease No: UTU-0285A
API No: 43-047- Agreement: Chapita Wells Unit

OFFICE NUMBER: (435) 781-4400

OFFICE FAX NUMBER: (435) 781-3420

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with the applicable
laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill including Surface and
Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors.
A copy of the approved APD must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion operations. This
permit is approved for a two (2) year period, or until lease expiration, whichever occurs first. An additional
extension, up to two (2) years, may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and
(Notify Environmental Scientist) access roads.

Location Completion - Prior to moving on the drilling rig.
(Notify Environmental Scientist)

Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notify Petroleum Engineer)

Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.) cementing all casing strings to:

blm ut vn opreport@blm.gov

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.)

First Production Notice - WithinFive (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify Petroleum Engineer) production resumes after well has been off production for

morethan ninety (90)
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SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

• All new and replacement internal combustion gas field engines of less than or equal to 300 design-
rated horsepower must not emit more than 2 gms of NOx per horsepower-hour. This requirement
does not apply to gas field engines of less than or equal to 40 design-rated horsepower.

• All and replacement internal combustion gas field engines of greater than 300 design rated
horsepower must not emit more than 1.0 gms of NOxper horsepower-hour.

• Ifthere is an active Gilsonite mining operation within 2 miles of the well location, operator shall
notifythe Gilsonite operator at least 48 hours prior to any blasting during construction.

• If paleontological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop
work and contact the Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will be made by the AO as to what
mitigationmay be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material before construction can
continue.

• Surface pipelines will be placed 5-10 feet outside of the borrow area.

• Monitor the initial ground disturbing construction of the well pad by a qualified permitted
paleontologist and thereafterspot-monitor the location during the remainder of the construction
process. Report all mitigation-curation of vertebrates and other scientifically significant fossils that
may be affected by the
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DOWNHOLE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE COAs:

• Cement for the surface casing shall be circulated to surface and/or topped off.

• Gamma ray Log shall be run from Total Depth to Surface.

• Cement for the production casing must be brought to at least 200' above the surface casing shoe.

Variances Granted: Air Drilling

• Properly lubricated and maintained rotating head. Variance granted to use a properly maintained
and lubricated diverter bowl in place of a rotating head.

• Blooie line discharge 100' from the well bore. Variances granted for blooie line discharge to be 75'
from the well bore and may not be straight.

• Compressors located in the opposite direction from the blooie line a minimum of 100' from the well
bore. Variance granted for rig mounted air compressors located within 40' of the well.

• In lieu of mud products on location, operator will have sufficient water on location for the mud kill
medium during air drilling operations.

• Automatic igniter. Variance granted for igniter, a diffuser will be used instead. Operator will mount a
deflector at the end of the blooie line to change direction and reduce the velocityof the cuttings flow
to the reserve pit.

• De-dusting Equipment. Variance granted, dust controlled by water mist during air drilling
operations.

All provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly adhered
to. The following items are emphasized:

DRILLINGICOMPLETIONIPRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

• The spud date and timeshall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of spudding.

• NotifyVernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least 24 hours in
advance of casinq cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure tests.

• AIIrequirements listed in Onshore Order #2 Ill. E. Special Drilling Operations are applicable for air
drilling of surface hole.

• Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use until the well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times.
Choke manifolds shall be located outside of the rig
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• All BOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the daily
drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order
No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be performed by a
test pump with a chart recorder and NOT by the rig pumps. Test shall be reported in the driller's
log.

• BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from under
the surface casing and weekly thereafteras specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

• Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and
cemented in place.

• No aggressivelfresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

• Cement baskets shall not be run on surface casing.

• The operator must report all shows of water or water-bearing sands to the BLM. Ifflowing water is
encountered it must be sampled, analyzed, and a copy of the analyses submitted to the BLMVernal
Field Office.

• The operator must report encounters of all non oil& gas mineral resources (such as Gilsonite, tar
sands, oil shale, trona, etc.) to the Vernal Field Office, in writing, within 5 working days of each
encounter. Each report shall include the well namelnumber, well location, date and depth (from KB
or GL) of encounter, vertical footage of the encounter and, the name of the person making the
report (along with a telephone number) should the BLMneed to obtain additional information.

• A complete set of angular deviation and directional surveys of a directional well will be submitted to
the Vernal BLMoffice engineer within 30 days of the completion of the well.

• While actively drilling, chronologic drilling progress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM,
Vernal Field Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers
until the well is completed.

• A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the top of cement and shall
be utilizedto determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of the CBL
to this office.

• Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
BLM_UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

• There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Any changes in operation must
have prior approval from the BLMVernal Field
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OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

• Allwells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance
with43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator, lease serial
number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

• For information regarding production reporting, contact the Office of Natural Resources Revenue
(ONRR) at www.ONRR.qov.

• Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLMVernal Field office must be
notified when it is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be by written communication
and must be received in this office by not later than the fifth business day following the date on
which the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a minimum,the following
informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephonenumber.

o Well name and number.

o Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royalty will be
paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise the
non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will be
repoded to the BLM,Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A, shall be repoded
verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than Major Events" will
be repoded in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on the Monthly Report of
Operations and Production.

• Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and Recompletion
Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days after completion of
the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1.
Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled
during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be filed on BLM Form 3160-4.
Submit with the well completion report a geologic report including, at a minimum,formation tops,
and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys, sample descriptions, strip
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core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid,
and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the BLM,Vernal Field Office.

• All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease, shall have prior
written approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The BLMVernal Field Office
Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and timefor the initial meter calibration and all
future meter proving schedules. A copy ofthe meter calibration reports shall be submitted to the
BLMVernal Field Office. AIImeasurement facilities will conform to the API standards for liquid
hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement. AIImeasurement points shall
be identified as the point of sale or allocation for royaltypurposes.

• A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted to
the BLMVernal Field Office within30 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs first.
AIIsite security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be adhered to. All
product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks willbe effectivelysealed in
accordance with Onshore Oil& Gas Order No. 3.

• Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filing of a
suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLMVernal Field Office. Emergency approval may be
obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

• No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior approval
of the BLMVernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30 days, prior
approval of the BLMVernal Field Office shall be obtained and notificationgiven before resumption
of operations.

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water produced
from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent disposal
method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day period. In
order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal method shall be
submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but no later than 45 days
after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not been approved prior to the
end of the authorized 90-day period will be considered as an Incident of Noncompliance and will be
grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for disposing of said water is
provided and approved by this office.

• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notifiedat least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or abandoned,
all pits must be fenced immediately untilthey are backfilled. The "Subsequent Report of
Abandonment" (Form BLM3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual plugging of
the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of casing left in
hole, and the current status of the surface
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SUBMITAS EMAIL Print Form

BLM- Vernal Field Office - NotificationForm

Operator EOG RESOURCES Rig Name/# TRUE 34
Submitted By BILL SNAPP Phone Number877-352-0710
Well Name/Number CWU 1542-26DX
Qtr/QtrNE/NE Section n Township es Range22E
Lease Serial Number UTUO285A
API Number V3dWray¾

Spud Notice - Spud is the initial spuddingof the well,not drilling
out below a casingstring.

Date/Time AM PM

Casing - Please report time casing run starts, not cementing
times.

Surface Casing
Intermediate Casing
Production Casin
Liner
Other

Date/Time AM PM

BOPE
Initial BOPEtest at surfacecasingpoint RECEIVED
BOPEtest at intermediate casing point ggg
30 day BOPEtest

O Other DNOFOL.GMMMG

Date/Time03/30/2012 13:00 AM PM

Remarks Approximate



Form 3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 2007) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: July 31, 2010

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. LeaseSerialNo.
UTUO285A

la. Type of Well O Oil Well Gas Well O Dry O Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion New Well O Work Over 0 Deepen O Plug Back O Diff. Resvr.

Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.
CHAPITAWELLS

2. Name of Operator Contact: MICKENZIEGATES 8. Lease Name and Well No.
EOG RESOURCES, INC. E-Mail: MICKENZIE_GATES@EOGRESOURCES.COM CWU 1542-26DX /

3. Address 600 17TH SREET SUITE 1000N 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. API Well No.
DENVER, CO 80202 Ph: 435-781-9145 43-047-52395

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)* 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
NATURALBUTTES

At surface NENE 449FNL 471FEL 40.013006 N Lat, 109.399436 W Lon 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and Survey
At top prod interval reported below

,
NENE 449FNL 471FEL 40.013006 N Lat, 109.399436 W Lon or Area Sec 26 T9S R22E Mer SLB

12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth NL EL 40.013006 N Lat, 109.399436 W Lon UINTAH UT

14. Date Spudded 15. Date T D. Reached 16. Date Completed 17. Elevations (DF, KB, RT, GL)*
02/11/2012 04/05/2012 OD & A Ready to P . 5015 GL

05/21/2012
18. Total Depth: MD 9375 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 9318 20. Del th Bridge Plug Set: MD

TVD 9315 TVDgg9969• TVD
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Was well cored? No O Yes (Submit analysis)

CBL/CCLIVDL/GR Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit analysis)
Directional Survey? O No Yes (Submit analysis)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Top Bottom Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry Vol.
Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.)

(MD) (MD) Depth Type of Cement (BBL)
Cement Top* Amount Pulled

12.250 9.625 K-55 36.0 2274 625 0
7.875 4.500 N-80 11.6 9369 1855 750

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)
2.375 7697 |

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf Status
A) MESAVERDE 7036 9129 8963 TO 9129 36 OPEN
B) 8769 TO 8925 36 OPEN
C) 8552 TO 8737 36 OPEN
D) 8394 TO 8519 36 OPEN
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material

8963 TO 9129 770 BARRELS OF GELLED WATER &88,700#20/40 SAND

8769 TO 8925 916 BARRELS OF GELLEDWATER & 92,000#20/40 SAND

8552 TO 8737 1,035 BARRELS OF GELLEDWATER & 121,400#20/40 SAND

8394 TO 8519 996 BARRELS OF GELLEDWATER & 120,000#20/40 SAND
28. Production - Interval A

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production o
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
05/21/2012 06/02/2012 24 9.0 578.0 251.0 FLOWS FROM WELL

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. - 24 Hr. Oil - Gas Water . Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. 365 Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

24/64 SI 910.0 9 578 251 PGW
28a. Production - Interval B

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Product on BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

(See Instructions and spaces foradditional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #141932 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED



28b. Production - Interval C
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press, Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

28c. Production - Interval D
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Product on BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas(Sold, used forfuel,vented, etc.)
SOLD

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name

Meas. Depth
MESAVERDE 7036 9129 GREEN RIVER 1423

BIRDS NEST 1736
MAHOGANY 2342
UTELANDBUTTE 4579
WASATCH 4696
CHAPITA WELLS 5297
BUCK CANYON 5988
PRICE RIVER 7035

32. Additional remarks (include pluggingþrocedure):
Please see the attached.

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 6. Core Analysis 7 Other:

34. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions):
Electronic Submission #141932 Verified by the BLM Well Information System.

For EOG RESOURCES, INC., sent to the Vernal

Name(pleaseprint) MICKENZIE GATES Title REGULATORYASSISTANT

Signature Date 06/29/2012

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency
of the United States any false, fictitious or fradulent statements or representatioris as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1542-26DX- ADDITIONALREMARKS :

26. PERFORATION RECORD
8208-8359 36 OPEN
8016-8169 36 OPEN
7787-7981 36 OPEN
7510-7748 36 OPEN
7261-7469 36 OPEN
7036-7223 36 OPEN

27. ACID, FRACTURE TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
8208-8359 1,198 BARRELS GELLED WATER & 152,700# 20/40 SAND
8016-8169 1,159 BARRELS GELLED WATER & 147,800#20/40 SAND
7787-7981 865 BARRELS GELLED WATER & 105,500#20/40 SAND
7510-7748 883 BARRELS GELLED WATER & 105,100#20/40 SAÑD
7261-7469 1,043 BARRELS GELLED WATER & 120,900# 20/40 ŠÀND
7036-7223 1,387 BARRELS GELLED WATER & 187,800#20/40 SAND

32. FORMATION (LOG) MARKERS
Middle Price River 7862
Lower Price River 8682
Sego



DIRECTIONALDRILLM5

Survey Certification Sheet
Company: EOG Resources
API # 43-047-51743
Well Name: Chapita Well Unit #1542-26DX
SURFACE LOCATION
Uintah County, Utah
Sec. 26-T9S-R22E
449' From North Line, 471' From East Line
BOTTOM HOLE LOCATION @
9375' Measured Depth
9315.16' True Vertical Depth
-203.16' South, 486.88' East from Surface Location
Crescent Job Number: CA 12177
Surveyed from a depth of 0.0'-9375' MD
Type of survey: Crescent MWD (Measurement While Drilling)
Last Survey Date: April 6, 2012
Directional Supervisor: John Stringfellow

To whom it may concern,
I attached surveys in pdf and text format of the Chapita Well Unit 1542-26DX well.

The data and calculations for this survey have been checked by me and conform to the
standards and procedures set forth by Crescent Directional Drilling.
This report represents a true and correct Directional Survey of this well based on the original data
obtained at the well site. Wellbore Coordinates are calculated using minimum curvature.

John Stringfellow
Directional Coordinator
Rocky Mtn. Region
Crescent Directional Drilling
Off. (307)266-6500
Cell.



Soo- T EOG Resources
M

Azimuths to True North
Uintah County Utah400- Magnetic North: 10.97°

Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU #1542-26D Control WellMagnetic Field Latitude 40°0'46.951 N

Strength:52300.4snT Longitude 109°23'55.640W
Dip Angle: 65.88• True #34 @ 5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)300- Date: 2011/12/09 Ground Level 5015.0
Model: IGRF2010 Utah Central 4302

NAD1927(NADCONGONUS)
Tie into Surface Hole surveys Magnetic North is 10.97° East of True North (Magnetic Declination)

PBHL #1541200--

1541 Projection to TD

Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-260 ,-'

100- #1545 #1544 ,

#1546 #1 43 Ñ1542-26DX

0- OOg feSOUTCOS"
Tie int> Surface Hole surveys
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o -200-

Tie into Surface Hole Projection to TD

-300-
PBHL #1546 Projection to TD

PBHL #1542- Tie into Surface Hole suiveys Tie into Surface Hole surveys

-400-

32- #ssaamo #1541 60
-500

PBHL #1543 Projection to TD - #1545-26D
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EOG Resources
Uintah County Utah

Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU #1542-26DX 10' East

Latitude 40° O' 46.951 N
Longitude 109° 23' 55.512 W

Og feSOUTCOS WELL @ 5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Ground Level 5015.0

Utah Central 4302
NAD 1927 (NADCONCONUS)

Magnetic North is 10.95° East of True North (Magnetic Declination)

ANNOTATIONS WELLBORE TARGET DETAILS

TVD MD Annotation Name TVD +NI-S +El-W Shape
2166.9 2219.0 Tie into Surface Hole surveys Top Wasatch #1542 (New Location#625.0 -210.9 490.2 Point
9315.2 9375.0 Projection to TD PBHL #1542 (New location) 9315.0 -210.9 490.2 Circle (Radius: 50.0)

-750-
1800-

Design: Wellbore#1 (CWU #1542-26DX 10 East/Wellbore #1)
I

Created By: JBS Date: 14:32, April 30 20120-
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eog resources

EOG Resources
Uintah County Utah
Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Wellbore #1

Design: Wellbore #1

Standard Survey Report
30 April,



eogresources 3=ve epos
---- O

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: CWU #1542-26DX 10' East North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Project Uintah County Utah

Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah Central 4302

Site Chapita Well Unit 1541- 154GR6D

Site Position: Northing: 618,708.27ft Latitude: 40°0'46.951 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,588,474.21ft Longitude: 109° 23' 55.640 W

Position Uncertainty: 0.0 ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 1.35 °

Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East

Well Position +NI-S 0.0 ft Northing: 618,708.50 ft Latitude: 40° O' 46.951 N
+El-W 0.0 ft Easting: 2,588,484.21 ft Longitude: 109° 23' 55.512 W

Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 5,015.0ft

Wellbore Wellbore #1

Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength(°) (*) (nT)
IGRF2010 01/26/12 10.95 65.88 52,287

Design Wellbore #1

Audit Notes:
Version: 1.0 Phase: ACTUAL Tie On Depth: 0.0

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +N/-S +El-W Direction
(ft) (ft) (ft) (*)
0.0 0.0 0.0 112.65

Survey Program Date 04/12/12

From To
(ft) (ft) Survey (Wellbore) Tool Name Description

122.0 2,219.0 Surface Hole surveys (Wellbore #1) MWD MWD - Standard
2,309.0 9,375.0 7 7/8" Hole surveys (Wellbore #1) MWD MWD - Standard

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (°) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°l100ft) (*/100ft) (°l100ft)

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
122.0 0.20 343.80 122.0 0.2 -0.1 -0.1 0.16 0.16 0.00
150.0 1.10 3.50 150.0 0.5 -0.1 -0.3 3.26 3.21 70.36
178.0 1.30 15.00 178.0 1.1 0.0 -0.4 1.11 0.71 41.07
209.0 1.70 32.60 209.0 1.8 0.4 -0.4 1.95 1.29 56.77

237.0 2.20 38.50 237.0 2.6 0.9 -0.1 1.92 1.79 21.07
268.0 2.60 41.60 267.9 3.6 1.8 0.3 1.36 1.29 10.00
299.0 3.20 49.10 298.9 4.7 2.9 0.9 2.29 1.94 24.19
330.0 3.50 51.70 329.8 5.8 4.3 1.7 1.08 0.97 8.39
361.0 4.10 55.60 360.8 7.0 6.0 2.8 2.11 1.94 12.58

392.0 4.50 56.70 391.7 8.3 7.9 4.1 1.32 1.29 3.55
423.0 4.90 63.00 422.6 9.6 10.1 5.6 2.10 1.29 20.32
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Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL@5034 Oft(Original Well Elev)
Well: CWU #1542-26DX 10' East North Reference: True
Weilbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curiature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°l100ft) (°l100ft) (°/100ft)

453.0 5.20 64.30 452.5 10.8 12.4 7.3 1.07 1.00 4.33
484.0 5.60 67.70 483.3 12.0 15.1 9.3 1.65 1.29 10.97
514.0 6.40 74.80 513.2 13.0 18.1 11.7 3.63 2.67 23.67
546.0 7.20 78.70 544.9 13.8 21.8 14.8 2.89 2.50 12.19
577.0 7.90 83.50 575.7 14.4 25.8 18.2 3.04 2.26 15.48
608.0 8.50 85.90 606.4 14.8 30.2 22.1 2.23 1.94 7.74
640.0 9.20 88.00 638.0 15.1 35.1 26.6 2.41 2.19 6.56
672.0 9.90 89.20 669.5 15.2 40.4 31.4 2.27 2.19 3.75
702.0 10.40 91.30 699.1 15.2 45.7 36.3 2.07 1.67 7.00
734.0 11.10 92.20 730.5 15.0 51.7 41.9 2.25 2.19 2.81
764.0 11.90 93.30 759.9 14.7 57.6 47.5 2.76 2.67 3.67
796.0 12.60 94.30 791.2 14.3 64.4 53.9 2.29 2.19 3.12
827.0 13.10 95.20 821.4 13.7 71.3 60.5 1.74 1.61 2.90

858.0 13.50 95.30 851.6 13.1 78.4 67.3 1.29 1.29 0.32
890.0 14.20 95.40 882.6 12.3 86.0 74.6 2.19 2.19 0.31
921.0 14.50 96.70 912.7 11.5 93.6 82.0 1.42 0.97 4.19
952.0 14.90 97.10 942.6 10.6 101.5 89.6 1.33 1.29 1.29
984.0 14.80 99.50 973.6 9.4 109.6 97.5 1.95 -0.31 7.50

1,014.0 14.60 101.00 1,002.6 8.0 117.1 104.9 1.43 -0.67 5.00
1,046.0 14.60 102.60 1,033.6 6.4 125.0 112.9 1.26 0.00 5.00
1,077.0 14.60 103.90 1,063.6 4.6 132.6 120.6 1.06 0.00 4.19
1,107.0 14.80 106.00 1,092.6 2.6 139.9 128.1 1.90 0.67 7.00
1,137.0 15.00 107.20 1,121.6 0.4 147.3 135.8 1.23 0.67 4.00
1,168.0 14.90 108.40 1,151.5 -2.0 154.9 143.7 1.05 -0.32 3.87
1,199.0 14.70 109.80 1,181.5 -4.6 162.4 151.7 1.32 -0.65 4.52
1,230.0 14.50 111.30 1,211.5 -7.3 169.7 159.5 1.38 -0.65 4.84
1,262.0 14.40 113.00 1,242.5 -10.4 177.1 167.4 1.36 -0.31 5.31
1,293.0 14.20 115.10 1,272.5 -13.5 184.1 175.1 1.79 -0.65 6.77

1,324.0 14.40 115.60 1,302.6 -16.7 191.0 182.7 0.76 0.65 1.61
1,356.0 14.20 115.80 1,333.6 -20.2 198.2 190.6 0.64 -0.62 0.62
1,388.0 14.50 115.30 1,364.6 -23.6 205.3 198.6 1.01 0.94 -1.56

1,418.0 14.40 115.80 1,393.6 -26.8 212.1 206.0 0.53 -0.33 1.67
1,449.0 14.70 115.10 1,423.6 -30.2 219.1 213.8 1.12 0.97 -2.26

1,480.0 14.60 116.30 1,453.6 -33.6 226.2 221.6 1.03 -0.32 3.87
1,511.0 14.70 116.80 1,483.6 -37.1 233.2 229.5 0.52 0.32 1.61
1,543.0 14.70 117.90 1,514.6 -40.8 240.4 237.6 0.87 0.00 3.44
1,573.0 14.80 117.40 1,543.6 -44.4 247.1 245.2 0.54 0.33 -1.67

1,606.0 15.00 118.30 1,575.5 -48.3 254.7 253.6 0.93 0.61 2.73

1,636.0 15.10 119.70 1,604.4 -52.1 261.5 261.4 1.26 0.33 4.67
1,668.0 15.20 120.20 1,635.3 -56.3 268.7 269.7 0.51 0.31 1.56
1,698.0 15.40 121.50 1,664.3 -60.3 275.5 277.5 1.32 0.67 4.33
1,730.0 15.60 121.40 1,695.1 -64.8 282.8 285.9 0.63 0.62 -0.31

1,760.0 15.50 121.80 1,724.0 -69.0 289.7 293.9 0.49 -0.33 1.33
1,792.0 15.30 121.80 1,754.9 -73.5 296.9 302.3 0.62 -0.62 0.00
1,822.0 15.70 120.90 1,783.8 -77.7 303.7 310.2 1.56 1.33 -3.00

1,854.0 15.60 120.90 1,814.6 -82.1 311.1 318.7 0.31 -0.31 0.00
1,885.0 15.70 121.50 1,844.4 -86.4 318.3 327.0 0.61 0.32 1.94
1,917.0 16.20 121.20 1,875.2 -91.0 325.8 335.7 1.58 1.56 -0.94

1,947.0 16.20 122.80 1,904.0 -95.4 332.9 344.0 1.49 0.00 5.33
1,979.0 16.00 123.80 1,934.7 -100.3 340.3 352.7 1.07 -0.62 3.12
2,009.0 16.20 125.10 1,963.6 -105.0 347.2 360.8 1.37 0.67 4.33
2,040.0 16.40 124.30 1,993.3 -110.0 354.3 369.3 0.97 0.65 -2.58

2,072.0 16.00 126.10 2,024.1 -115.1 361.6 378.0 2.01 -1.25 5.62

2,104.0 14.70 126.10 2,054.9 -120.1 368.5 386.3 4.06 -4.06 0.00
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Survey Reportog resources
Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: CWU #1542-26DX 10' East North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003 16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(II) (°) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (*/100ft) (°/100ft) (°l100ft)

2,135.0 13.50 124.80 2,085.0 -124.5 374.6 393.6 4.00 -3.87 -4.19

2,166.0 12.90 122.40 2,115.2 -128.4 380.5 400.6 2.62 -1.94 -7.74

2,196.0 12.50 119.80 2,144.4 -131.8 386.1 407.1 2.33 -1.33 -8.67

2,219.0 12.40 119.30 2,166.9 -134.2 390.5 412.0 0.64 -0.43 -2.17

Tie into Surface Hole surveys
2,309.0 11.70 118.40 2,254.9 -143.3 406.9 430.7 0.81 -0.78 -1.00

2,339.0 11.30 116.60 2,284.3 -146.1 412.2 436.7 1.79 -1.33 -6.00

2,371.0 10.50 114.90 2,315.7 -148.7 417.7 442.7 2.69 -2.50 -5.31

2,401.0 9.70 111.20 2,345.3 -150.8 422.5 448.0 3.43 -2.67 -12.33

2,433.0 9.20 108.60 2,376.8 -152.6 427.4 453.2 2.05 -1.56 -8.12

2,464.0 8.80 108.70 2,407.4 -154.1 432.0 458.1 1.29 -1.29 0.32
2,497.0 8.80 106.80 2,440.1 -155.7 436.8 463.1 0.88 0.00 -5.76

2,529.0 8.40 106.70 2,471.7 -157.0 441.4 467.9 1.25 -1.25 -0.31

2,561.0 7.90 107.80 2,503.4 -158.4 445.8 472.4 1.64 -1.56 3.44
2,591.0 7.10 104.40 2,533.1 -159.5 449.5 476.3 3.05 -2.67 -11.33

2,623.0 6.70 101.20 2,564.9 -160.3 453.3 480.0 1.73 -1.25 -10.00

2,653.0 6.20 100.10 2,594.7 -160.9 456.6 483.3 1.72 -1.67 -3.67

2,684.0 5.80 99.20 2,625.5 -161.5 459.8 486.5 1.33 -1.29 -2.90

2,715.0 5.60 103.20 2,656.4 -162.1 462.8 489.5 1.43 -0.65 12.90
2,745.0 5.50 107.80 2,686.2 -162.9 465.6 492.4 1.52 -0.33 15.33

2,777.0 5.30 111.40 2,718.1 -163.9 468.4 495.4 1.23 -0.62 11.25
2,807.0 5.00 110.40 2,748.0 -164.8 470.9 498.1 1.04 -1.00 -3.33

2,839.0 4.50 109.40 2,779.9 -165.7 473.4 500.7 1.58 -1.56 -3.12

2,870.0 4.00 109.50 2,810.8 -166.5 475.6 503.0 1.61 -1.61 0.32
2,901.0 4.00 110.00 2,841.7 -167.2 477.6 505.2 0.11 0.00 1.61

2,932.0 3.80 110.50 2,872.6 -168.0 479.6 507.3 0.65 -0.65 1.61
2,964.0 3.20 112.00 2,904.6 -168.7 481.4 509.2 1.90 -1.87 4.69
2,994.0 2.20 113.60 2,934.5 -169.2 482.7 510.7 3.34 -3.33 5.33
3,026.0 1.50 120.70 2,966.5 -169.7 483.6 511.7 2.30 -2.19 22.19
3,058.0 1.20 123.30 2,998.5 -170.1 484.3 512.4 0.96 -0.94 8.12
3,089.0 0.90 124.60 3,029.5 -170.4 484.8 513.0 0.97 -0.97 4.19
3,119.0 0.60 115.60 3,059.5 -170.6 485.1 513.4 1.07 -1.00 -30.00

3,151.0 0.30 51.10 3,091.5 -170.6 485.3 513.6 1.70 -0.94 -201.56

3,244.0 1.20 344.30 3,184.5 -169.5 485.2 513.1 1.20 0.97 -71.83

3,337.0 1.00 319.30 3,277.5 -168.0 484.4 511.8 0.55 -0.22 -26.88

3,430.0 1.00 287.20 3,370.5 -167.1 483.1 510.2 0.59 0.00 -34.52

3,523.0 0.50 242.80 3,463.4 -167.1 482.0 509.2 0.79 -0.54 -47.74

3,617.0 0.30 86.60 3,557.4 -167.2 481.9 509.1 0.83 -0.21 -166.17

3,711.0 0.30 143.60 3,651.4 -167.4 482.3 509.6 0.30 0.00 60.64
3,806.0 0.70 184.70 3,746.4 -168.2 482.4 509.9 0.54 0.42 43.26
3,899.0 0.60 139.30 3,839.4 -169.1 482.6 510.6 0.55 -0.11 -48.82

3,992.0 0.60 79.60 3,932.4 -169.4 483.4 511.4 0.64 0.00 -64.19

4,086.0 0.90 118.00 4,026.4 -169.7 484.6 512.5 0.61 0.32 40.85
4,181.0 0.40 112.40 4,121.4 -170.1 485.5 513.6 0.53 -0.53 -5.89

4,274.0 0.50 .157.10 4,214.4 -170.6 486.0 514.2 0.38 . 0.11 48.06.
4,368.0 0.70 280.00 4,308.4 -170.9 485.6 514.0 1.13 0.21 130.74
4,460.0 0.70 239.40 4,400.4 -171.1 484.6 513.1 0.53 0.00 -44.13

4,554.0 0.30 327.20 4,494.4 -171.2 483.9 512.5 0.80 -0.43 93.40
4,647.0 0.40 212.40 4,587.4 -171.3 483.6 512.3 0.64 0.11 -123.44

4,684.6 0.08 221.74 4,625.0 -171.4 483.5 512.2 0.86 -0.86 24.84
Top Wasatch #1542 (New Location) - Top Wasatch #1542 (New Location)

4,740.0 0.40 27.90 4,680.4 -171.2 483.6 512.3 0.86 0.58 299.88
4,834.0 0.10 106.00 4,774.4 -171.0 483.8 512.4 0.42 -0.32 83.09
6929 R20 1542¶ 4 8§9.4 91 484 512& M§ 0.11 5074
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Survey Report -

Weog resources
Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL@5034 Oft (Original Well Elev)
Well: CWU #1542-26DX 10' East North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +N/-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°/100ft) (°l100ft) (°l100ft)

5,023.0 0.40 153.40 4,963.4 -171.6 484.2 512.9 0.21 0.21 -0.85

5,116.0 0.40 173.70 5,056.4 -172.2 484.4 513.3 0.15 0.00 21.83

5,210.0 0.50 170.80 5,150.4 -172.9 484.5 513.7 0.11 0.11 -3.09

5,304.0 0.70 165.10 5,244.4 -173.9 484.7 514.3 0.22 0.21 -6.06

5,399.0 0.90 170.40 5,339.4 -175.2 485.0 515.0 0.22 0.21 5.58
5,493.0 0.10 54.40 5,433.4 -175.9 485.2 515.5 1.01 -0.85 -123.40

5,588.0 0.00 4.70 5,528.4 -175.8 485.2 515.5 0.11 -0.11 0.00

5,682.0 0.10 83.90 5,622.4 -175.8 485.3 515.6 0.11 0.11 0.00
5,776.0 0.30 109.60 5,716.4 -175.9 485.6 515.9 0.23 0.21 27.34
5,870.0 0.40 136.40 5,810.4 -176.2 486.1 516.5 0.20 0.11 28.51
5,965.0 0.30 136.40 5,905.4 -176.6 486.5 517.0 0.11 -0.11 0.00
6,059.0 0.40 132.30 5,999.4 -177.0 486.9 517.5 0.11 0.11 -4.36

6,153.0 0.50 142.50 6,093.4 -177.6 487.4 518.2 0.14 0.11 10.85
6,245.0 0.50 144.80 6,185.4 -178.2 487.9 518.9 0.02 0.00 2.50
6,338.0 0.60 135.50 6,278.4 -178.9 488.4 519.7 0.14 0.11 -10.00

6,433.0 0.70 143.10 6,373.4 -179.7 489.1 520.6 0.14 0.11 8.00
6,526.0 0.50 335.80 6,466.4 -179.8 489.3 520.8 1.28 -0.22 -179.89

6,619.0 0.40 310.20 6,559.3 -179.2 488.9 520.2 0.24 -0.11 -27.53

6,709.0 0.20 323.40 6,649.3 -178.9 488.6 519.8 0.23 -0.22 14.67
6,803.0 0.20 283.50 6,743.3 -178.7 488.3 519.5 0.15 0.00 -42.45

6,896.0 0.20 293.80 6,836.3 -178.6 488.0 519.2 0.04 0.00 11.08
6,990.0 0.10 286.30 6,930.3 -178.5 487.8 518.9 0.11 -0.11 -7.98

7,083.0 0.10 258.10 7,023.3 -178.5 487.6 518.8 0.05 0.00 -30.32

7,178.0 0.30 206.30 7,118.3 -178.8 487.4 518.7 0.26 0.21 -54.53

7,271.0 0.50 220.60 7,211.3 -179.3 487.1 518.5 0.24 0.22 15.38
7,365.0 0.70 208.60 7,305.3 -180.1 486.5 518.4 0.25 0.21 -12.77

7,459.0 0.90 183.80 7,399.3 -181.3 486.2 518.5 0.42 0.21 -26.38

7,553.0 0.90 185.20 7,493.3 -182.8 486.1 519.0 0.02 0.00 1.49
7,647.0 0.60 174.30 7,587.3 -184.0 486.1 519.4 0.35 -0.32 -11.60

7,741.0 0.60 172.20 7,681.3 -185.0 486.2 519.9 0.02 0.00 -2.23

7,837.0 0.90 182.40 7,777.3 -186.3 486.2 520.4 0.34 0.31 10.62
7,930.0 0.70 180.60 7,870.3 -187.6 486.2 520.9 0.22 -0.22 -1.94

8,024.0 1.10 166.50 7,964.3 -189.0 486.4 521.7 0.48 0.43 -15.00

8,114.0 0.00 68.45 8,054.3 -189.9 486.6 522.2 1.22 -1.22 0.00
8,207.0 0.20 214.10 8,147.3 -190.0 486.5 522.1 0.22 0.22 0.00
8,301.0 0.80 196.30 8,241.3 -190.8 486.2 522.2 0.65 0.64 -18.94

8,395.0 1.30 206.50 8,335.2 -192.3 485.6 522.2 0.57 0.53 10.85
8,487.0 0.70 190.10 8,427.2 -193.8 485.0 522.2 0.72 -0.65 -17.83

8,581.0 0.90 188.10 8,521.2 -195.1 484.8 522.5 0.21 0.21 -2.13

8,674.0 0.90 191.70 8,614.2 -196.6 484.5 522.9 0.06 0.00 3.87
8,769.0 0.70 204.10 8,709.2 -197.8 484.1 523.0 0.28 -0.21 13.05
8,863.0 0.20 101.50 8,803.2 -198.4 484.1 523.1 0.82 -0.53 -109.15

8,957.0 0.40 94.80 8,897.2 -198.4 484.6 523.6 0.22 0.21 -7.13

9,050.0 0.60 176.70 8,990.2 -199.0 484.9 524.1 0.72 0.22 88.06
9,144.0 0.70 163.80 9,084.2 -200.0 485.1 524.7 0.19 0.11 -13.72

9,238.0 0.80 150.60 9,178.2 -201.1 485.6 525.6 0.21 0.11 -14.04

9,320.0 1.10 146.50 9,260.2 -202.3 486.3 526.7 0.37 0.37 -5.00

9,375.0 1.10 146.50 9,315.2 -203.2 486.9 527.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
Projection to TD - PBHL #1542 (New location)
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Survey Reportog resources
Company: EOG Resources Eocal Coordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Weli: CWU #1542-26DX 10' East North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Targets

Target Name
- hit/miss target Dip Angle Dip Dir. TVD +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting
- Shape (*) (*) {ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

PBHL #1542 (New loc 0.00 0.00 9,315.0 -210.9 490.2 618,509.18 2,588,979.27 40° O' 44.867 N 109° 23' 49.211 W
- actual wellpath misses target center by 8.4ft at 9375.0ft MD (9315.2 TVD, -203.2 N, 486.9 E)
- Circle (radius 50.0)

Top Wasatch #1542 ( 0.00 0.00 4,625.0 -210.9 490.2 618,509.18 2,588,979.27 40° O' 44.867 N 109° 23' 49.211 W
- actual wellpath misses target center by 40.1ft at 4684.6ft MD (4625.0 TVD, -171.4 N, 483.5 E)
- Point

Design Annotations

Measured Vertical Local Coordinates
Depth Depth +NAS +El-W

(ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Comment
2,219.0 2,166.9 -134.2 390.5 Tie into Surface Hole surveys
9,375.0 9,315.2 -203.2 486.9 Projection to TD

Checked By: Approved By: Date:
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eog resources

EOG Resources
Uintah County Utah
Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Wellbore #1

Design: Wellbore #1

Survey Report - Geographic
30 April,



Survey Report - Geographicog resources
Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: CWU #1542-26DX 10' East North Reference: True
Welfbore: Wellbore #1 Sunrey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Project Uintah County Utah

Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah Central 4302

Site Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D

Site Position: Northing: 618,708.27ft Latitude: 40° O'46.951 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,588,474.21ft Longitude: 109° 23' 55.640 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0 ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 1.35 °

Well Position +NI-S 0.0 ft North ing: 618,708.50 ft Latitude: 40° O'46.951 N
+El-W 0.0 ft Easting: 2,588,484.21 ft Longitude: 109°23' 55.512 W

Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 5,015.0ft

Wellbore Wellbore #1

Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength(*) (°) (nT)
IGRF2010 01/26/12 10.95 65.88 52,287

Design Wellbore #1

Audit Notes:

Version: 1.0 Phase: ACTUAL Tie On Depth: 0.0

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +NI-S +El-W Direction
(ft) (ft) (ft) (°)
0.0 0.0 0.0 112.65

122.0 2,219.0 Surface Hole surveys (Wellbore #1) MWD MWD - Standard
2,309.0 9,375.0 7 7/8" Hole surveys (Wellbore #1) MWD MWD - Standard
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eog resources Ney Report - Geographic -

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: CWU #1542-26DX 10' East North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Map Map
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting

(It) (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 618,708.50 2,588,484.21 40° O'46.951 N 109° 23' 55.512 W
122.0 0.20 343.80 122.0 0.2 -0.1 618,708.71 2,588,484.14 40° O'46.953 N 109° 23' 55.513 W
150.0 1.10 3.50 150.0 0.5 -0.1 618,709.02 2,588,484.14 40° O'46.956 N 109° 23' 55.513 W
178.0 1.30 15.00 178.0 1.1 0.0 618,709.60 2,588,484.22 40° O'46.962 N 109° 23' 55.511 W
209.0 1.70 32.60 209.0 1.8 0.4 618,710.33 2,588,484.55 40° O'46.969 N 109° 23' 55.507 W
237.0 2.20 38.50 237.0 2.6 0.9 618,711.12 2,588,485.09 40° O'46.977 N 109° 23' 55.500 W
268.0 2.60 41.60 267.9 3.6 1.8 618,712.13 2,588,485.90 40° O'46.987 N 109° 23' 55.489 W
299.0 3.20 49.10 298.9 4.7 2.9 618,713.25 2,588,486.99 40° O'46.997 N 109° 23' 55.475 W
330.0 3.50 51.70 329.8 5.8 4.3 618,714.43 2,588,488.36 40° O'47.009 N 109° 23' 55.457 W
361.0 4.10 55.60 360.8 7.0 6.0 618,715.68 2,588,489.99 40° O'47.021 N 109° 23' 55.435 W
392.0 4.50 56.70 391.7 8.3 7.9 618,717.02 2,588,491.89 40° 0' 47.034 N 109° 23' 55.411 W
423.0 4.90 63.00 422.6 9.6 10.1 618,718.34 2,588,494.06 40° O' 47.046 N 109° 23' 55.382 W
453.0 5.20 64.30 452.5 10.8 12.4 618,719.57 2,588,496.40 40° O' 47.058 N 109° 23' 55.352 W
484.0 5.60 67.70 483.3 12.0 15.1 618,720.81 2,588,499.03 40° O'47.069 N 109° 23' 55.318 W
514.0 6.40 74.80 513.2 13.0 18.1 618,721.88 2,588,501.98 40° O'47.079 N 109° 23' 55.280 W
546.0 7.20 78.70 544.9 13.8 21.8 618,722.82 2,588,505.64 40° O' 47.088 N 109° 23' 55.232 W
577.0 7.90 83.50 575.7 14.4 25.8 618,723.54 2,588,509.65 40° O'47.094 N 109° 23' 55.180 W
608.0 8.50 85.90 606.4 14.8 30.2 618,724.05 2,588,514.04 40° O'47.098 N 109° 23' 55.124 W
640.0 9.20 88.00 638.0 15.1 35.1 618,724.42 2,588,518.95 40° O'47.100 N 109° 23' 55.061 W
672.0 9.90 89.20 669.5 15.2 40.4 618,724.67 2,588,524.25 40° O' 47.102 N 109° 23' 54.992 W
702.0 10.40 91.30 699.1 15.2 45.7 618,724.77 2,588,529.54 40° O' 47.101 N 109° 23' 54.925 W
734.0 11.10 92.20 730.5 15.0 51.7 618,724.73 2,588,535.50 40° O'47.100 N 109° 23' 54.848 W
764.0 11.90 93.30 759.9 14.7 57.6 618,724.58 2,588,541.48 40° O'47.097 N 109° 23' 54.771 W
796.0 12.60 94.30 791.2 14.3 64.4 618,724.29 2,588,548.27 40° O'47.092 N 109° 23' 54.684 W
827.0 13.10 95.20 821.4 13.7 71.3 618,723.88 2,588,555.15 40° O'47.087 N 109° 23' 54.596 W
858.0 13.50 95.30 851.6 13.1 78.4 618,723.39 2,588,562.26 40° O'47.080 N 109° 23' 54.504 W
890.0 14.20 95.40 882.6 12.3 86.0 618,722.86 2,588,569.90 40° O'47.073 N 109° 23' 54.406 W
921.0 14.50 96.70 912.7 11.5 93.6 618,722.23 2,588,577.56 40° O'47.065 N 109° 23' 54.308 W
952.0 14.90 97.10 942.6 10.6 101.5 618,721.46 2,588,585.39 40° O'47.056 N 109° 23' 54.208 W
984.0 14.80 99.50 973.6 9.4 109.6 618,720.47 2,588,593.53 40° O'47.044 N 109° 23' 54.104 W

1,014.0 14.60 101.00 1,002.6 8.0 117.1 618,719.29 2,588,601.05 40° O'47.031 N 109° 23' 54.007 W
1,046.0 14.60 102.60 1,033.6 6.4 125.0 618,717.83 2,588,608.98 40° O'47.014 N 109° 23' 53.906 W
1,077.0 14.60 103.90 1,063.6 4.6 132.6 618,716.22 2,588,616.63 40° O' 46.997 N 109° 23' 53.808 W
1,107.0 14.80 106.00 1,092.6 2.6 139.9 618,714.43 2,588,624.03 40° O' 46.977 N 109° 23' 53.714 W
1,137.0 15.00 107.20 1,121.6 0.4 147.3 618,712.40 2,588,631.47 40° O' 46.955 N 109° 23' 53.618 W
1,168.0 14.90 108.40 1,151.5 -2.0 154.9 618,710.13 2,588,639.14 40° O' 46.931 N 109° 23' 53.521 W
1,199.0 14.70 109.80 1,181.5 -4.6 162.4 618,707.72 2,588,646.68 40° O'46.906 N 109° 23' 53.424 W
1,230.0 14.50 111.30 1,211.5 -7.3 169.7 618,705.15 2,588,654.06 40° O'46.879 N 109° 23' 53.330 W
1,262.0 14.40 113.00 1,242.5 -10.4 177.1 618,702.31 2,588,661.52 40° O'46.849 N 109° 23' 53.235 W
1,293.0 14.20 115.10 1,272.5 -13.5 184.1 618,699.36 2,588,668.58 40° O' 46.818 N 109° 23' 53.146 W
1,324.0 14.40 115.60 1,302.6 -16.7 191.0 618,696.25 2,588,675.58 40° O' 46.786 N 109° 23' 53.057 W
1,356.0 14.20 115.80 1,333.6 -20.2 198.2 618,692.99 2,588,682.78 40° O' 46.752 N 109° 23' 52.965 W
1,388.0 14.50 115.30 1,364.6 -23.6 205.3 618,689.73 2,588,690.01 40° O'46.718 N 109° 23' 52.873 W
1,418.0 14.40 115.80 1,393.6 -26.8 212.1 618,686.67 2,588,696.84 40° O'46.686 N 109° 23' 52.786 W
1,449.0 14.70 115.10 1,423.6 -30.2 219.1 618,683.49 2,588,703.95 40° O'46.653 N 109° 23' 52.696 W
1,480.0 14.60 116.30 1,453.6 -33.6 226.2 618,680.25 2,588,711.09 40° O'46.619 N 109° 23' 52.605 W
1,511.0 14.70 116.80 1,483.6 -37.1 233.2 618,676.91 2,588,718.19 40° O'46.585 N 109° 23' 52.515 W
1,543.0 14.70 117.90 1,514.6 -40.8 240.4 618,673.35 2,588,725.48 40° O'46.548 N 109° 23' 52.422 W
1,573.0 14.80 117.40 1,543.6 -44.4 247.1 618,669.97 2,588,732.33 40° O'46.513 N 109° 23' 52.335 W
1,606.0 15.00 118.30 1,575.5 -48.3 254.7 618,666.18 2,588,739.92 40° O'46.474 N 109° 23' 52.239 W
1,636.0 15.10 119.70 1,604.4 -52.1 261.5 618,662.57 2,588,746.82 40° O'46.436 N 109° 23' 52.151 W
1,668.0 15.20 120.20 1,635.3 -56.3 268.7 618,658.56 2,588,754.17 40° O'46.395 N 109° 23' 52.058 W
1,698.0 15.40 121.50 1,664.3 -60.3 275.5 618,654.66 2,588,761.05 40° O'46.355 N 109° 23' 51.971 W
1,730.0 15.60 121.40 1,695.1 -64.8 282.8 618,650.38 2,588,768.45 40° O'46.311 N 109° 23' 51.877 W
1,760.0 15.50 121.80 1,724.0 -69.0 289.7 618,646.32 2,588,775.40 40° O'46.269 N 109° 23' 51.789 W
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Survey Report - GeographicWeog resources on

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL @5034 Oft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL @5034 Oft (Original Well Elev)
Well: CWU #1542-26DX 10' East North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Mimmum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003 16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Map Map
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting

(II) (°) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude
1,792.0 15.30 121.80 1,754.9 -73.5 296.9 618,642.02 2,588,782.73 40° O'46.225 N 109° 23' 51.696 W
1,822.0 15.70 120.90 1,783.8 -77.7 303.7 618,638.01 2,588,789.67 40° O'46.184 N 109° 23' 51.608 W
1,854.0 15.60 120.90 1,814.6 -82.1 311.1 618,633.75 2,588,797.18 40° O'46.140 N 109° 23' 51.513 W
1,885.0 15.70 121.50 1,844.4 -86.4 318.3 618,629.59 2,588,804.43 40° O' 46.097 N 109° 23' 51.421 W
1,917.0 16.20 121.20 1,875.2 -91.0 325.8 618,625.19 2,588,812.05 40° O'46.052 N 109° 23' 51.325 W
1,947.0 16.20 122.80 1,904.0 -95.4 332.9 618,620.92 2,588,819.24 40° O'46.008 N 109° 23' 51.233 W
1,979.0 16.00 123.80 1,934.7 -100.3 340.3 618,616.23 2,588,826.77 40° O'45.960 N 109° 23' 51.138 W
2,009.0 16.20 125.10 1,963.6 -105.0 347.2 618,611.68 2,588,833.74 40° O'45.913 N 109° 23' 51.050 W
2,040.0 16.40 124.30 1,993.3 -110.0 354.3 618,606.90 2,588,841.01 40° O'45.864 N 109° 23' 50.958 W
2,072.0 16.00 126.10 2,024.1 -115.1 361.6 618,601.93 2,588,848.42 40° O'45.814 N 109° 23' 50.864 W
2,104.0 14.70 126.10 2,054.9 -120.1 368.5 618,597.10 2,588,855.38 40° O' 45.764 N 109° 23' 50.776 W
2,135.0 13.50 124.80 2,085.0 -124.5 374.6 618,592.86 2,588,861.63 40° O' 45.721 N 109° 23' 50.697 W
2,166.0 12.90 122.40 2,115.2 -128.4 380.5 618,589.08 2,588,867.62 40° O' 45.682 N 109° 23' 50.621 W
2,196.0 12.50 119.80 2,144.4 -131.8 386.1 618,585.81 2,588,873.34 40° O' 45.648 N 109° 23' 50.549 W
2,219.0 12.40 119.30 2,166.9 -134.2 390.5 618,583.47 2,588,877.71 40° O' 45.624 N 109° 23' 50.493 W
Tie into Surface Hole surveys
2,309.0 11.70 118.40 2,254.9 -143.3 406.9 618,574.78 2,588,894.37 40° O' 45.535 N 109° 23' 50.282 W
2,339.0 11.30 116.60 2,284.3 -146.1 412.2 618,572.15 2,588,899.74 40° 0' 45.507 N 109° 23' 50.214 W
2,371.0 10.50 114.90 2,315.7 -148.7 417.7 618,569.64 2,588,905.25 40° O'45.481 N 109° 23' 50.144 W
2,401.0 9.70 111.20 2,345.3 -150.8 422.5 618,567.69 2,588,910.13 40° O' 45.461 N 109° 23' 50.082 W
2,433.0 9.20 108.60 2,376.8 -152.6 427.4 618,566.02 2,588,915.11 40° O' 45.443 N 109° 23' 50.018 W
2,464.0 8.80 108.70 2,407.4 -154.1 432.0 618,564.58 2,588,919.74 40° O' 45.428 N 109° 23' 49.959 W
2,497.0 8.80 106.80 2,440.1 -155.7 436.8 618,563.15 2,588,924.58 40° O'45.413 N 109° 23' 49.897 W
2,529,0 8.40 106.70 2,471.7 -157.0 441.4 618,561.88 2,588,929.20 40° O'45.399 N 109° 23' 49.838 W
2,561.0 7.90 107.80 2,503.4 -158.4 445.8 618,560.64 2,588,933.56 40° O'45.386 N 109° 23' 49.783 W
2,591.0 7.10 104.40 2,533.1 -159.5 449.5 618,559.64 2,588,937.34 40° O'45.375 N 109° 23' 49.734 W
2,623.0 6.70 101.20 2,564.9 -160.3 453.3 618,558.87 2,588,941.11 40° O'45.367 N 109° 23' 49.686 W
2,653.0 6.20 100.10 2,594.7 -160.9 456.6 618,558.32 2,588,944.43 40° O'45.360 N 109° 23' 49.644 W
2,684.0 5.80 99.20 2,625.5 -161.5 459.8 618,557.86 2,588,947.64 40° O'45.355 N 109° 23' 49.603 W
2,715.0 5.60 103.20 2,656.4 -162.1 462.8 618,557.33 2,588,950.67 40° O'45.349 N 109° 23' 49.564 W
2,745.0 5.50 107.80 2,686.2 -162.9 465.6 618,556.62 2,588,953.48 40° O'45.341 N 109° 23' 49.528 W
2,777.0 5.30 111.40 2,718.1 -163.9 468.4 618,555.68 2,588,956.34 40° O'45.332 N 109° 23' 49.491 W
2,807.0 5.00 110.40 2,748.0 -164.8 470.9 618,554.78 2,588,958.88 40° O' 45.322 N 109° 23' 49.459 W
2,839.0 4.50 109.40 2,779.9 -165.7 473.4 618,553.94 2,588,961.39 40° O'45.313 N 109° 23' 49.427 W
2,870.0 4.00 109.50 2,810.8 -166.5 475.6 618,553.22 2,588,963.58 40° O' 45.306 N 109° 23' 49.399 W
2,901.0 4.00 110.00 2,841.7 -167.2 477.6 618,552.54 2,588,965.63 40° O' 45.298 N 109° 23' 49.373 W
2,932.0 3.80 110.50 2,872.6 -168.0 479.6 618,551.86 2,588,967.62 40° O'45.291 N 109° 23' 49.348 W
2,964.0 3.20 112.00 2,904.6 -168.7 481.4 618,551.19 2,588,969.46 40° O'45.284 N 109° 23' 49.324 W
2,994.0 2.20 113.60 2,934.5 -169.2 482.7 618,550.68 2,588,970.78 40° O'45.279 N 109° 23' 49.307 W
3,026.0 1.50 120.70 2,966.5 -169.7 483.6 618,550.24 2,588,971.71 40° O' 45.274 N 109° 23' 49.296 W
3,058.0 1.20 123.30 2,998.5 -170.1 484.3 618,549.86 2,588,972.36 40° O' 45.270 N 109° 23' 49.287 W
3,089.0 0.90 124.60 3,029.5 -170.4 484.8 618,549.55 2,588,972.84 40° O' 45.267 N 109° 23' 49.281 W
3,119.0 0.60 115.60 3,059.5 -170.6 485.1 618,549.36 2,588,973.18 40° O' 45.265 N 109° 23' 49.277 W
3,151.0 0.30 51.10 3,091.5 -170.6 485.3 618,549.34 2,588,973.40 40° O' 45.265 N 109° 23' 49.274 W
3,244.0 1.20 344.30 3,184.5 -169.5 485.2 618,550.43 2,588,973.30 40° O'45.276 N 109° 23' 49.275 W
3,337.0 1.00 319.30 3,277.5 -168.0 484.4 618,551.97 2,588,972.47 40° O'45.291 N 109° 23' 49.285 W
3,430.0 1.00 287.20 3,370.5 -167.1 483.1 618,552.79 2,588,971.14 40° O'45.300 N 109° 23' 49.302 W
3,523.0 0.50 242.80 3,463.4 -167.1 482.0 618,552.82 2,588,970.01 40° O' 45.300 N 109° 23' 49.317 W
3,617.0 0.30 86.60 3,557.4 -167.2 481.9 618,552.64 2,588,969.89 40° O'45.298 N 109° 23' 49.318 W
3,711.0 0.30 143.60 3,651.4 -167.4 482.3 618,552.47 2,588,970.29 40° O' 45.297 N 109° 23' 49.313 W
3,806.0 0.70 184.70 3,746.4 -168.2 482.4 618,551.69 2,588,970.40 40° O'45.289 N 109° 23' 49.312 W
3,899.0 0.60 139.30 3,839.4 -169.1 482.6 618,550.76 2,588,970.70 40° O' 45.280 N 109° 23' 49.308 W
3,992.0 0.60 79.60 3,932.4 -169.4 483.4 618,550.50 2,588,971.50 40° O' 45.277 N 109° 23' 49.298 W
4,086.0 0.90 118.00 4,026.4 -169.7 484.6 618,550.27 2,588,972.64 40° O' 45.274 N 109° 23' 49.284 W
M§LP_ Re ]12& ,129

-170 85 5 §1§,54g82 ggg ig° ' 5.279 99°2g§9.2 W
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Survey Report - GeographicWieogresources .a

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: CWU #1542-26DX 10' East North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Map Map
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting

(II) (°) (°) (II) (ft) (ft) (II) (ft) Latitude Longitude

4,274.0 0.50 157.10 4,214.4 -170.6 486.0 618,549.33 2,588,974.09 40° O'45.265 N 109° 23' 49.265 W
4,368.0 0.70 280.00 4,308.4 -170.9 485.6 618,549.04 2,588,973.69 40° O' 45.262 N 109° 23' 49.271 W
4,460.0 0.70 239.40 4,400.4 -171.1 484.6 618,548.83 2,588,972.66 40° O'45.260 N 109° 23' 49.284 W
4,554.0 0.30 327.20 4,494.4 -171.2 483.9 618,548.73 2,588,972.03 40° O' 45.259 N 109° 23' 49.292 W
4,647.0 0.40 212.40 4,587.4 -171.3 483.6 618,548.65 2,588,971.73 40° O'45.259 N 109° 23' 49.296 W
4,684.6 0.08 221.74 4,625.0 -171.4 483.5 618,548.52 2,588,971.64 40° O'45.257 N 109° 23' 49.297 W
Top Wasatch #1542 (New Location) - Top Wasatch #1542 (New Location)
4,740.0 0.40 27.90 4,680.4 -171.2 483.6 618,548.67 2,588,971.70 40° O'45.259 N 109° 23' 49.296 W
4,834.0 0.10 106.00 4,774.4 -171.0 483.8 618,548.94 2,588,971.93 40° O'45.261 N 109° 23' 49.293 W
4,929.0 0.20 154.20 4,869.4 -171.1 484.0 618,548.77 2,588,972.09 40° O'45.260 N 109° 23' 49.291 W
5,023.0 0.40 153.40 4,963.4 -171.6 484.2 618,548.33 2,588,972.31 40° O'45.255 N 109° 23' 49.288 W
5,116.0 0.40 173.70 5,056.4 -172.2 484.4 618,547.73 2,588,972.51 40° O'45.249 N 109° 23' 49.286 W
5,210.0 0.50 170.80 5,150.4 -172.9 484.5 618,547.00 2,588,972.63 40° O' 45.242 N 109° 23' 49.285 W
5,304.0 0.70 165.10 5,244.4 -173.9 484.7 618,546.04 2,588,972.86 40° O' 45.232 N 109° 23' 49.282 W
5,399.0 0.90 170.40 5,339.4 -175.2 485.0 618,544.75 2,588,973.17 40° O' 45.220 N 109° 23' 49.278 W
5,493.0 0.10 54.40 5,433.4 -175.9 485.2 618,544.08 2,588,973.37 40° O' 45.213 N 109° 23' 49.276 W
5,588.0 0.00 4.70 5,528.4 -175.8 485.2 618,544.13 2,588,973.44 40° O' 45.213 N 109° 23' 49.275 W
5,682.0 0.10 83.90 5,622.4 -175.8 485.3 618,544.14 2,588,973.52 40° O'45.213 N 109° 23' 49.274 W
5,776.0 0.30 109.60 5,716.4 -175.9 485.6 618,544.07 2,588,973.84 40° O' 45.213 N 109° 23' 49.270 W
5,870.0 0.40 136.40 5,810.4 -176.2 486.1 618,543.76 2,588,974.30 40° O' 45.210 N 109° 23' 49.264 W
5,965.0 0.30 136.40 5,905.4 -176.6 486.5 618,543.35 2,588,974.71 40° O' 45.205 N 109° 23' 49.259 W
6,059.0 0.40 132.30 5,999.4 -177.0 486.9 618,542.96 2,588,975.13 40° O' 45.201 N 109° 23' 49.254 W
6,153.0 0.50 142.50 6,093.4 -177.6 487.4 618,542.43 2,588,975.64 40° O'45.196 N 109° 23' 49.247 W
6,245.0 0.50 144.80 6,185.4 -178.2 487.9 618,541.79 2,588,976.13 40° O'45.190 N 109° 23' 49.241 W
6,338.0 0.60 135.50 6,278.4 -178.9 488.4 618,541.13 2,588,976.72 40° O'45.183 N 109° 23' 49.234 W
6,433.0 0.70 143.10 6,373.4 -179.7 489.1 618,540.33 2,588,977.44 40° O'45.175 N 109° 23' 49.225 W
6,526.0 0.50 335.80 6,466.4 -179.8 489.3 618,540.25 2,588,977.61 40° O'45.174 N 109° 23' 49.223 W
6,619.0 0.40 310.20 6,559.3 -179.2 488.9 618,540.82 2,588,977.19 40° O'45.180 N 109° 23' 49.228 W
6,709.0 0.20 323.40 6,649.3 -178.9 488.6 618,541.14 2,588,976.84 40° O'45.183 N 109° 23' 49.232 W
6,803.0 0.20 283.50 6,743.3 -178.7 488.3 618,541.30 2,588,976.58 40° O'45.185 N 109° 23' 49.236 W
6,896.0 0.20 293.80 6,836.3 -178.6 488.0 618,541.40 2,588,976.27 40° O'45.186 N 109° 23' 49.240 W
6,990.0 0.10 286.30 6,930.3 -178.5 487.8 618,541.48 2,588,976.04 40° O'45.187 N 109° 23' 49.243 W
7,083.0 0.10 258.10 7,023.3 -178.5 487.6 618,541.48 2,588,975.89 40° O' 45.187 N 109° 23' 49.245 W
7,178.0 0.30 206.30 7,118.3 -178.8 487.4 618,541.24 2,588,975.70 40° O'45.184 N 109° 23' 49.247 W
7,271.0 0.50 220.60 7,211.3 -179.3 487.1 618,540.70 2,588,975.34 40° O' 45.179 N 109° 23' 49.252 W
7,365.0 0.70 208.60 7,305.3 -180.1 486.5 618,539.87 2,588,974.82 40° O'45.171 N 109° 23' 49.259 W
7,459.0 0.90 183.80 7,399.3 -181.3 486.2 618,538.63 2,588,974.52 40° O'45.159 N 109° 23' 49.263 W
7,553.0 0.90 185.20 7,493.3 -182.8 486.1 618,537.15 2,588,974.44 40° O'45.144 N 109° 23' 49.264 W
7,647.0 0.60 174.30 7,587.3 -184.0 486.1 618,535.93 2,588,974.45 40° O' 45.132 N 109° 23' 49.265 W
7,741.0 0.60 172.20 7,681.3 -185.0 486.2 618,534.95 2,588,974.59 40° O' 45.122 N 109° 23' 49.263 W
7,837.0 0.90 182.40 7,777.3 -186.3 486.2 618,533.70 2,588,974.66 40° O' 45.110 N 109° 23' 49.263 W
7,930.0 0.70 180.60 7,870.3 -187.6 486.2 618,532.40 2,588,974.65 40° O' 45.097 N 109° 23' 49.263 W
8,024.0 1.10 166.50 7,964.3 -189.0 486.4 618,530.96 2,588,974.89 40° O'45.083 N 109° 23' 49.261 W
8,114.0 0.00 68.45 8,054.3 -189.9 486.6 618,530.12 2,588,975.11 40° O'45.075 N 109° 23' 49.258 W
8,207.0 0.20 214.10 8,147.3 -190.0 486.5 618,529.99 2,588,975.02 40° O' 45.073 N 109° 23' 49.259 W
8,301.0 0.80 196.30 8,241.3 -190.8 486.2 618,529.21 2,588,974.77 40° O' 45.066 N 109° 23' 49.263 W
8,395.0 1.30 206.50 8,335.2 -192.3 485.6 618,527.62 2,588,974.14 40° O' 45.050 N 109° 23' 49.271 W
8,487.0 0.70 190.10 8,427.2 -193.8 485.0 618,526.12 2,588,973.61 40° O' 45.035 N 109° 23' 49.278 W
8,581.0 0.90 188.10 8,521.2 -195.1 484.8 618,524.81 2,588,973.44 40° O'45.023 N 109° 23' 49.281 W
8,674.0 0.90 191.70 8,614.2 -196.6 484.5 618,523.37 2,588,973.22 40° O'45.008 N 109° 23' 49.284 W
8,769.0 0.70 204.10 8,709.2 -197.8 484.1 618,522.10 2,588,972.86 40° O'44.996 N 109° 23' 49.289 W
8,863.0 0.20 101.50 8,803.2 -198.4 484.1 618,521.54 2,588,972.80 40° O' 44.990 N 109° 23' 49.290 W
8,957.0 0.40 94.80 8,897.2 -198.4 484.6 618,521.49 2,588,973.29 40° O' 44.990 N 109° 23' 49.284 W
9,050.0 0.60 176.70 8,990.2 -199.0 484.9 618,520.99 2,588,973.66 40° O'44.985 N 109° 23' 49.279 W
9,144.0 0.70 163.80 9,084.2 -200.0 485.1 618,519.95 2,588,973.87 40° O'44.974 N 109° 23' 49.277 W
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Survey Report - GeographicWeogresources
Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1542-26DX 10' East
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: WELL @5034.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Well: CWU #1542-26DX 10' East North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Map Map
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +Nl-S +El-W Northing Easting

(ft) (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

9,238.0 0.80 150.60 9,178.2 -201.1 485.6 618,518.84 2,588,974.38 40° O' 44.963 N 109° 23' 49.271 W
9,320.0 1.10 146.50 9,260.2 -202.3 486.3 618,517.70 2,588,975.12 40° O' 44.952 N 109° 23' 49.262 W
9,375.0 1.10 146.50 9,315.2 -203.2 486.9 618,516.84 2,588,975.72 40° O' 44.943 N 109° 23' 49.254 W

Projection to TD - PBHL #1542 (New location)

PBHL #1542 (New loc 0.00 0.00 9,315.0 -210.9 490.2 618,509.18 2,588 979.27 40° O'44.867 N 109° 23' 49.211 W
- actual wellpath misses target center by 8.4ft at 9375.0ft MD (9315.2 TVD, -203.2 N, 486.9 E)
- Circle (radius 50.0)

Top Wasatch #1542 ( 0.00 0.00 4,625.0 -210.9 490.2 618,509.18 2,588,979.27 40° O' 44.867 N 109° 23' 49.211 W
- actual wellpath misses target center by 40.1ft at 4684.6ft MD (4625.0 TVD, -171.4 N, 483.5 E)
- Point

DeãÏëríAnnothfiäris

Measured Vertical Local Coordinates
Depth Depth +N/-S +El-W

(ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Comment
2,219.0 2,166.9 -134.2 390.5 Tie into Surface Hole surveys
9,375.0 9,315.2 -203.2 486.9 Projection to TD

Checked By: Approved By: Date:
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