
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

  
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME and NUMBER

Chapita Wells Unit 1544-26D 

2. TYPE OF WORK

DRILL NEW WELL     REENTER P&A WELL     DEEPEN WELL  
3. FIELD OR WILDCAT

NATURAL BUTTES  

4. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well             Coalbed Methane Well: NO 

5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
CHAPITA WELLS  

6. NAME OF OPERATOR
EOG Resources, Inc. 

7. OPERATOR PHONE
435 781-9111 

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N, Denver, CO, 80202 

9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
kaylene_gardner@eogresources.com 

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER
(FEDERAL, INDIAN, OR STATE)

UTU0285A 

11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP

FEDERAL    INDIAN    STATE    FEE  
12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP

FEDERAL    INDIAN    STATE    FEE  

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee')
  

14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')

 

18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

YES  (Submit Commingling Application)    NO  

19. SLANT
  

VERTICAL   DIRECTIONAL   HORIZONTAL  

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 447 FNL   501 FEL NENE 26 9.0 S 22.0 E S 

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 1240 FNL   624 FEL NENE 26 9.0 S 22.0 E S 

At Total Depth 1240 FNL   624 FEL NENE 26 9.0 S 22.0 E S 

21. COUNTY
UINTAH  

22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet)
923 

23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
1800 

 
 

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL
(Applied For Drilling or Completed)

580 

26. PROPOSED DEPTH
MD: 9415     TVD: 9310 

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL

5015 

28. BOND NUMBER

NM2308 

29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

49-225 

Hole, Casing, and Cement Information

String Hole Size Casing Size Length Weight Grade & Thread Max Mud Wt. Cement Sacks Yield Weight

 SURF  12.25  9.625  0 - 2300  36.0   J-55 ST&C  10.5  Class G  150  3.82  11.0

        Class G  135  1.18  15.6

 PROD  7.875  4.5  0 - 9415  11.6   N-80 LT&C  10.5  Hi Lift "G"  130  3.91  11.0

        50/50 Poz  910  1.28  14.1

ATTACHMENTS
 

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES
 

 WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER  COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY

DRILLED)

TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

NAME Mickenzie Gates TITLE Operations Clerk PHONE 435 781-9145 

SIGNATURE DATE 06/24/2011 EMAIL mickenzie_gates@eogresources.com 

API NUMBER ASSIGNED

    43047517310000

    
Permit Manager 

APPROVAL

FORM 3

AMENDED REPORT

API Well Number: 43047517310000

FORM 3
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAMEC pdit WMe
s nit 1544-26D

2. TYPE OF WORK 3. FIELD OR WILDCAT
DRILL NEW WELLI REENTER P&A WELL DEEPEN WELL I NATURAL BUTTES

4. TYPE OF WELL 5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
Gas Well Coalbed Methane Well: NO CHAPITA WELLS

6. NAME OF OPERATOR 7. OPERATOR PHONE
EOG Resources, Inc. 435 781-9111

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N, Denver, CO, 80202 kaylene_gardner@eogresources.com

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER 11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP 12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
(FEDERAL,INDIAN,ORUSTU8A FEDERAL I INDIAN I STATE FEE FEDERAL INDIAN STATEI FEEl

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME 18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM 19. SLANT

(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

YES (Submit Commingling Application) NO VERTICAL DIRECTIONAL HORIZONTAL I

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 447 FNL 501 FEL NENE 26 9.0 S 22.0 E S

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 1240 FNL 624 FEL NENE 26 9.0 S 22.0 E S

At Total Depth 1240 FNL 624 FEL NENE 26 9.0 S 22.0 E S

21. COUNTY 22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet) 23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
UINTAH 923 1800

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL 26. PROPOSED DEPTH(Applied For Drilling or Completed) MD: 9415 TVD: 9310
580

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL 28. BOND NUMBER 29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

5015 NM2308 49-225

Hole, Casing, and Cement Information

String Hole Size Casing Size Length Weight Grade & Thread Max Mud Wt. Cement Sacks Yield Weight

SURF 12.25 9.625 0 - 2300 36.0 J-55 ST&C 10.5 Cass G 150 3.82 11.0

Class G 135 1.18 15.6

PROD 7.875 4.5 0 - 9415 11.6 N-80 LT&C 10.5 Hi Lift "G" 130 3.91 11.0

50/50 Poz 910 1.28 14.1

ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

DRILLED)

NAME Mickenzie Gates TITLE Operations Clerk PHONE 435 781-9145

SIGNATURE DATE 06/24/2011 EMAIL mickenzle_gates@eogresources.com

API NUMBER ASSIGNED APPROVAL

43047517310000

Permit



API Well Number: 43047517310000

DRILLINGPLAN eogresources
MULTI-WELL PAD:

CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26D, CWU 1543-26D,
CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D, CWU 1546-26D

NE/NE, SEC. 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M..
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATEDTOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATERZONES:

CWU1541-26D CWU1542-26D CWU1 i43-26D CWU1544-26D
FORMATION TVD MD TVD MD TVD MD TVD MD
Green River 1540 1546 1514 1528. 1517 1532 1520 1536

Birdsnest 1754 1762 1730 1750 1717 1735 1716 1743
Mahogany OilShale Bed 2296 2307 2281 2315 2276 2304 2268 2327

Wasatch 4653 4667 4625 4677 4617 4661 4600 4705
Chapita Wells 5241 5255 5215 5268 5208 5252 5193 5298
Buck Canyon 5903 5916 5870 5923 5852 5896 5812 5917
North Horn 6608 6622 6586 6639 6587 6632 6593 6698

KMVPrice River 6985 6998 6941 6994 6934 6978 6920 7025
KMVPrice River Middle 7855 7868 7813 7865 7807 7851 7795 7900
KMVPrice River Lower 8636 8650 8602 8654 8596 8640 8586 8691

Sego 9148 9162 9112 9164 9114 9158 9107 9212
TD 9350 9364 9315 9367 9315 9359 9310 9415

ANTICIPATED BHP (PSI) 5105 5086 5086 5083

CWU 1545-26D CWU1546-26D
FORMATION TVD MD TVD MD
Green River 1530 1546 1543 1565

Birdsnest 1726 1750 1738 1770
Mahogany OilShale Bed 2280 2323 2288 2344

Wasatch 4623 4691 4641 4732
Chapita Wells 5213 5281 5229 5320
Buck Canyon 5852 5921 5886 5977
North Horn 6594 6662 6595 6686

KMVPrice River 6951 7020 6979 7070
KMV Price River Middle 7821 7889 7843 7933
KMVPrice River Lower 8611 8679 8632 8722

Sego 9139 9208 9146 9237
TD 9340 9409 9350 9441

ANTICIPATEDBHP (PSI) 5100 5105

1. Fresh Waters mayexist in the upper, approximately 1,000 ft ± of the Green River Formation,withtop at about 2,000 ft ±.
2, Cement isolation is installed to surface of the well isolatingallzones by cement.

8 point plan-EOG 1/5



API Well Number: 43047517310000

DRILLINGPLAN eogresommes
MULTI-WELL PAD:

CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26D, CWU 1543-26D,
CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D, CWU 1546-26D

NE/NE, SEC. 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M..
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: Production Hole - 5000 Psig
BOP schematic diagrams attached.

4. CASINGPROGRAM:

Hole Rating RatingCasing Size
_

Length Size Weight Grade Thread Collapse Burst Tensile
Conductor 20" O - 60' 14" 32.5# A252 1800 PSI 10,000#

Surface 12 ¼" 0 -2,300's 9 ¾" 36.0# J-55 STC 2020 PSI 3520 PSI 394,000#
Production 7 7/8" Surface -- TD 4 ½" 11.6# N-80 LTC 6350 PSI 7780 PSI 223,000#

12 ¼" surface hole will be drilled to a total depth of 200's below the base of the Green River lostcirculation zone and cased w/9-¾" as shown to that depth. Drilled depth may be shallower ordeeper than the 2300' shown above depending on the actual depth of the loss zone.

All casing will be new or inspected.

5. Float Equipment:

Surface Hole Procedure (0'-2300'±)

Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Centralizers: 1-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5thjOint to surface. (15 total)

Production Hole Procedure (2300'±- TD):

Float shoe, 1 joint casing, float collar and balance of casing to surface. 4-½", 11.6#, N-80 or equivalent markercollars or short casing joints to be placed at top of Price River and 400' above top of Wasatch. Centralizers to beplaced 5' above shoe on joint#1, top of joint #2, and every 3rd jointto 400' above the top of primary objective.Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of float collar, and top of 2ndjOÍnt.

6. MUD PROGRAM

Surface Hole Procedure (Surface - 2300'±):

0' - 2300'± Air/Airmist/Aerated water
or

A closed mud system will be utilizedwitha gelled bentonite system. LCM sweeps, additions,etc. willbe utilized as necessary.

8 point plan-EOG 2/5



API Well Number: 43047517310000

DRILLINGPLAN eogresomnes
MULTI-WELLPAD:

CWU1541-26D, CWU 1542-26D, CWU 1543-26D,
CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D, CWU 1546-26D

NE/NE, SEC. 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M..
UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH

Production Hole Procedure (2300'±- TD):

Anticipated mud weight 9.5-10.5 ppg depending on actul wellboreconditions encountered whiledrilling.

2300'±- TD A closed mud system willbe utilized.A bentonite gelled water mud system willbe used to controlviscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay encapsulation/inhibition.
Water loss willbe maintained at <15co's using white starch or PAC. Bactericides willbe used asneeded. Anticipated pH willrange from 9.0-10.0. Mud weight willbe adjusted as necessary forwell control. Deflocculants/thinners willbe used as necessary to maintainmud quality. LCMsweeps willbe utilizedas necessary to control lost circulationand mud loss. CO2 contamination,ifencountered,willbe treatedwithlime and gypsum.

7. VARIANCEREQUESTS:

Reference: Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 - Section E: Special Drilling Operations

o EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring a straight run blooie line to be 100' inlength. (Where possible, a straight run blooie line willbe used).

o EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiringthe blooie line to be 100' in length. Toreduce location excavation, the blooie line willbe approximately 75' in length.

o EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations, during air drilling operations only, requiringdedusting equipment.Dust during airdrillingoperations is controlled by water mist.

o EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations, during air drilling operations only, requiringanautomatic igniter or continuous pilot light on the blooie line. (Not required on aerated water system).
o EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance that compressors are located in the opposite direction from theblooie line a minimumof 100 feet from the wellbore. (AirCompressors are rig mounted).

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:

Logs: None
Cased-hole Logs: Cased-hole logs willbe run in lieu of open-hole logs consisting ofthe following:

Cement Bond / Casing Collar Locator and Gamma Ray

8 point plan-EOG 3/5



API Well Number: 43047517310000

DRILLINGPLAN OfWS &
MULTI-WELL PAD:

CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26D, CWU 1543-26D,
CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D, CWU 1546-26D

NE/NE, SEC. 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M..
UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (Surface - 2300'±\:

Lead: 150 sks Class "G"cement with 16% Gel, 10 #/sx Gilsonite,3% Salt, 2% CaCla,
3 lb/sx GR3 ¼ #/sx Flocele mixed at 11 ppg, 3.82 ft /sk. yield,23 gps water.

Tail: 135 sks Class "G"cement with2% CaCla, ¼#/sk Flocele mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 ft /sk.,
5.2 gps water.

Top Out: As necessary withClass "G"cement with2% CaCla, ¼#lsk Flocele mixedat 15.6
ppg, 1.18 ft /sk., 5.2 gps water.

Note: The above number of sacks is based on gauge-hole calculation
Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to surface.
Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement to 500' above the shoe.

Production Hole Procedure (2300'±- TD)

Lead: 130 sks: Hi-Lift"G"w/12% D20 (Bentonite), 1% D79 (Extender), 5% D44
(Salt),0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.25% Dii2 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.25 pps D29(cello flakes) mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.91 ft /sk., 24.5 gps water.

Tall: 910 sks: 50:50 Poz "G"w/2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.075%
Dí3 (Retarder), 0.2% Di67 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),
mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 ft /sk., 5.9gps water.

Note: The above number of sacks is based on gauge-hole calculation.
Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to 200'± above 9-5/8" casing shoe.
Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement to 400'± above top of Wasatch.

Final Cement volumes will be based upon gauqe-hole plus 45% excess.

8 point plan-EOG 4/5



API Well Number: 43047517310000

DRILLINGPLAN eogmsources
MULTI-WELLPAD:

CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26D, CWU 1543-26D,
CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D, CWU 1546-26D

NE/NE, SEC. 26, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M..
UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

Surface Hole (Surface - 2300'±):

Lost circulation

Production Hole (2300'±- TD):

Sloughing shales, lost circulation and key seat development are possible in the WasatchFormation.

11. STANDARDREQUIRED EOUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Upper and Lower Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUSCHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds willbeused, produced, stored, transported,or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of thiswell. Furthermore,no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used,produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association withthe drilling of thiswell.

13.Air DrillInq Operations:

1. MainAir Compressors are 1250 CFM350 psi with2000 psi Boosters and are rig mounted.
2. Secondary Air Compressors are 1170 CFM350 psi with2000 psi Boosters and are rigmounted.
3. Minimumsettingdepth of conductor casing willbe 60' GL or 10'± into cornpetent formation, whichever isdeeper, as determined by the EOG person incharge. Exceptions must be approved by an EOG drillingsuperintendent or manager.

4. The diameter of the diverter flow line willbe a minimumof 10" to help reduce back pressure on the wellbore during uncontrolled flow.

5. Rat and Mouse hole drilling willoccur onlyafter surface casing has been set and cemented.
6. EOG Resources, Inc. willuse a properly maintainedand lubricated stripperhead.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG 5/5



Azimuths to True North
Magnetic North: 11.24°

Magnetic Field

Strength: 52551.5snT
Dip Angle: 65.95°

Date: 9/21/2009
Model: IGRF200510

T M

SECTION DETAILS

Sec MD Inc Azi TVD +N/-S +E/-W DLeg TFace VSec Target
1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2 400.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3 1666.67 19.00 188.63 1643.58 -205.75 -31.23 1.50 188.63 208.10
4 2531.37 19.00 188.63 2461.17 -484.08 -73.47 0.00 0.00 489.62
5 4431.38 0.00 0.00 4326.55 -792.70 -120.31 1.00 180.00 801.78
6 7104.83 0.00 0.00 7000.00 -792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00 801.78 CWU 1544-26D
7 9414.83 0.00 0.00 9310.00 -792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00 801.78

TARGET DETAILS

Name TVD +N/-S +E/-W Northing Easting Latitude Longitude Shape
CWU 1544-26D 7000.00 -792.70 -120.31 -110372.71 2588516.96 40° 0' 39.126 N 109° 23' 57.445 W Circle (Radius: 5 0.00)

Surface Location

NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS) Utah North 4301
Ground Elevation: 5015.00 RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)

Northing Easting Latittude Longitude
0.00 0.00 -109577.33 2588618.06 40° 0' 46.958 N 109° 23'  55.900 W
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Vertical Section at 188.63deg (1500 ft/in)

Start Build 1.50

Start 864.70 hold at 1666.67 MD

Start Drop -1.00

Start 2673.45 hold at 4431.38 MD

Start 2310.00 hold at 7104.83 MD

TD at 9414.83

Project: T9S-R22E Sec 26
Site: CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1_CWU 905-26_Set 13)
Well: 1544-26D
Plan: APD

CWU 1544-26D
Section 26 T9S R22E
Uintah County, UT

API Well Number: 43047517310000

-7eo 809 feSOUTCOS

O
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CWU 1544-26D
Section 26 T9S R22E

750 Uintah County, UT
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Surface Location

2250 i
NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS) Utah North 4301

- - - - - - - - - - - - S art Drop -1.00 Ground Elevation: 5015.00 RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)
Northing Easting Latittude Longitude

) -109577.33 2588618.06 40°0' 46.958 N 109°23' 55.900 W
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CWU 154/i-26

I I

-530 -250 0 200

5000 West(-)/East(+) (250 ft/in)
-------------- TDat9414.83

9750 M Azimulhs toTrue North
/\ Magnetic North: 11.24°

Project: T9S-R22E Sec 26 Magnetic Field
Site: CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1 CWU 905-26 Set 13)

-750 0 760 1500 Well: 1544-26D Strength: 52551.5snT

Plan: APD Dip Angle: 65.95°

Date: 9/21/2009
Vertical Section at 188.63deg (1500 ft/in) Model: IGRF200510

SECTION DETAILS

Sec MD Inc Azi TVD +N/-S +E/-W DLeg TFace VSec Target
1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2 400.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3 1666.67 19.00 188.63 1643.58 -205.75 -31.23 1.50 188.63 208.10
4 2531.37 19.00 188.63 2461.17 -484.08 -73.47 0.00 0.00 489.62
5 4431.38 0.00 0.00 4326.55 -792.70 -120.31 1.00 180.00 801.78
6 7104.83 0.00 0.00 7000.00 -792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00 801.78 CWU 1544-26D
7 9414.83 0.00 0.00 9310.00 -792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00 801.78

TARGET DETAILS

Name TVD +N/-S +El-W Northing Easting Latitude Longitude Shape
CWU 1544-26D 7000.00 -792.70 -120.31 -110372.71 2588516.96 40°0' 39.126 N 109°23' 57.445 W Circle (Radius: 5



Standard Planning Report

21 September, 2010

Plan: APD

Denver Division - Utah
T9S-R22E Sec 26

CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1_CWU 905-26_Set 13)
1544-26D

Wellbore #1

API Well Number: 43047517310000

Denver Division - Utah
T9S-R22E Sec 26
CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1_CWU 905-26_Set 13)
1544-26D
Wellbore #1

Plan: APD

Standard Planning Report
21 September,



Project:

Company:

Local Co-ordinate Reference:

TVD Reference:

Site:

Denver Division - Utah

T9S-R22E Sec 26

CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1_CWU 905-26_Set 13)

EOG RESOURCES INC.
Planning Report

Well:

Wellbore:

1544-26D

Wellbore #1

Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature

RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)

Design: APD

Database: EDM

MD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)

North Reference:

Well 1544-26D

True

Map System:

Geo Datum:

Project

Map Zone:

System Datum:US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution)
NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)

T9S-R22E Sec 26

Utah North 4301

Mean Sea Level

Site Position:

From:

Site

Latitude:

Longitude:

Position Uncertainty:

Northing:

Easting:

Grid Convergence:

CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1_CWU 905-26_Set 13)

ft

Lat/Long ft

ft

deg1.39Slot Radius: "

-109,625.48

2,588,631.00

0.00

40° 0' 46.480 N

109° 23' 55.748 W

Well

Well Position

Longitude:

Latitude:

Easting:

Northing:

ft

+E/-W

+N/-S

Position Uncertainty

ft

ft

ftGround Level:

1544-26D

ft

ft

0.00

0.00

-109,577.33

2,588,618.06

5,015.00Wellhead Elevation: ft0.00

40° 0' 46.958 N

109° 23' 55.900 W

Wellbore

Declination

(deg)

Field Strength

(nT)

Sample Date Dip Angle

(deg)

Wellbore #1

Model NameMagnetics

IGRF200510 9/21/2009 11.24 65.95 52,552

Phase:Version:

Audit Notes:

Design APD

PROTOTYPE

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD)

(ft)

+N/-S

(ft)

Direction

(deg)

+E/-W

(ft)

Tie On Depth: 0.00

188.630.000.000.00

Inclination

(deg)

Azimuth

(deg)

+E/-W

(ft)
TFO

(deg)

+N/-S

(ft)

Measured

Depth

(ft)

Vertical 

Depth

(ft)

Dogleg

Rate

(°/100ft)

Build

Rate

(°/100ft)

Turn

Rate

(°/100ft)

Plan Sections

Target

0.000.000.000.000.000.000.000.000.000.00

0.000.000.000.000.000.00400.000.000.00400.00

188.630.001.501.50-31.23-205.751,643.58188.6319.001,666.67

0.000.000.000.00-73.47-484.082,461.17188.6319.002,531.37

180.000.00-1.001.00-120.31-792.704,326.550.000.004,431.38

0.000.000.000.00-120.31-792.707,000.000.000.007,104.83 CWU 1544-26D

0.000.000.000.00-120.31-792.709,310.000.000.009,414.83
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API Well Number: 43047517310000
EOG RESOURCES INC.

Planning Report

Database: EDM Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well 1544-26D
Company: Denver Division - Utah TVD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)
Project: T9S-R22E Sec 26 MD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)
Site: CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1 CWU 905-26 Se North Reference: True
Well: 1544-26D Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: APD

Project T9S-R22E Sec 26

Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah North 4301

Site CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1 CWU 905-26 Set 13)

Site Position: Northing: -109,625.48ft Latitude: 40° O'46.480 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,588,631.00ft Longitude: 109° 23' 55.748 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.00 ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 1.39 deg

Well 1544-26D

Well Position +NI-S 0.00 ft Northing: -109,577.33ft Latitude: 40° O'46.958 N
+El-W 0.00 ft Easting: 2,588,618.06 ft Longitude: 109° 23' 55.900 W

Position Uncertainty 0.00 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 5,015.00ft

Wellbore Wellbore #1

Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength
(deg) (deg) (nT)

IGRF200510 9/21/2009 11.24 65.95 52,552

Design APD

Audit Notes:
Version: Phase: PROTOTYPE Tie On Depth: 0.00

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +N/-S +El-W Direction
(ft) (ft) (ft) (deg)

0.00 0.00 0.00 188.63

Plan Sections

Measured Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +N/-S +El-W Rate Rate Rate TFO

(ft) (deg) (deg) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°l100ft) (°/100ft) (°l100ft) (deg) Target

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
400.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

1,666.67 19.00 188.63 1,643.58 -205.75 -31.23 1.50 1.50 0.00 188.63
2,531.37 19.00 188.63 2,461.17 -484.08 -73.47 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,431.38 0.00 0.00 4,326.55 -792.70 -120.31 1.00 -1.00 0.00 180.00
7,104.83 0.00 0.00 7,000.00 -792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 CWU 1544-26D
9,414.83 0.00 0.00 9,310.00 -792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
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Project:

Company:

Local Co-ordinate Reference:

TVD Reference:

Site:

Denver Division - Utah

T9S-R22E Sec 26

CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1_CWU 905-26_Set 13)

EOG RESOURCES INC.
Planning Report

Well:

Wellbore:

1544-26D

Wellbore #1

Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature

RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)

Design: APD

Database: EDM

MD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)

North Reference:

Well 1544-26D

True

Measured

Depth

(ft)
Inclination

(deg)

Azimuth

(deg)

+E/-W

(ft)

Vertical

Section

(ft)

Dogleg

Rate

(°/100ft)
+N/-S

(ft)

Build

Rate

(°/100ft)

Turn

Rate

(°/100ft)

Planned Survey

Vertical 

Depth

(ft)

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.000.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
100.00 0.00 0.00 100.00 0.00 0.000.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
200.00 0.00 0.00 200.00 0.00 0.000.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
300.00 0.00 0.00 300.00 0.00 0.000.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
400.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 0.00 0.000.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

500.00 1.50 188.63 499.99 1.31 1.50-1.29 -0.20 1.50 0.00
600.00 3.00 188.63 599.91 5.23 1.50-5.18 -0.79 1.50 0.00
700.00 4.50 188.63 699.69 11.77 1.50-11.64 -1.77 1.50 0.00
800.00 6.00 188.63 799.27 20.92 1.50-20.69 -3.14 1.50 0.00
900.00 7.50 188.63 898.57 32.68 1.50-32.31 -4.90 1.50 0.00

1,000.00 9.00 188.63 997.54 47.03 1.50-46.49 -7.06 1.50 0.00
1,100.00 10.50 188.63 1,096.09 63.96 1.50-63.24 -9.60 1.50 0.00
1,200.00 12.00 188.63 1,194.16 83.47 1.50-82.52 -12.52 1.50 0.00
1,300.00 13.50 188.63 1,291.70 105.54 1.50-104.34 -15.84 1.50 0.00
1,400.00 15.00 188.63 1,388.62 130.15 1.50-128.68 -19.53 1.50 0.00

1,500.00 16.50 188.63 1,484.86 157.30 1.50-155.52 -23.60 1.50 0.00
1,600.00 18.00 188.63 1,580.36 186.95 1.50-184.83 -28.05 1.50 0.00
1,666.67 19.00 188.63 1,643.58 208.10 1.50-205.75 -31.23 1.50 0.00
1,700.00 19.00 188.63 1,675.10 218.96 0.00-216.48 -32.85 0.00 0.00
1,800.00 19.00 188.63 1,769.65 251.51 0.00-248.66 -37.74 0.00 0.00

1,900.00 19.00 188.63 1,864.20 284.07 0.00-280.85 -42.63 0.00 0.00
2,000.00 19.00 188.63 1,958.75 316.63 0.00-313.04 -47.51 0.00 0.00
2,100.00 19.00 188.63 2,053.30 349.18 0.00-345.23 -52.40 0.00 0.00
2,200.00 19.00 188.63 2,147.86 381.74 0.00-377.42 -57.28 0.00 0.00
2,300.00 19.00 188.63 2,242.41 414.30 0.00-409.61 -62.17 0.00 0.00

2,400.00 19.00 188.63 2,336.96 446.85 0.00-441.79 -67.05 0.00 0.00
2,500.00 19.00 188.63 2,431.51 479.41 0.00-473.98 -71.94 0.00 0.00
2,531.37 19.00 188.63 2,461.17 489.62 0.00-484.08 -73.47 0.00 0.00
2,600.00 18.31 188.63 2,526.20 511.58 1.00-505.79 -76.76 -1.00 0.00
2,700.00 17.31 188.63 2,621.40 542.17 1.00-536.03 -81.35 -1.00 0.00

2,800.00 16.31 188.63 2,717.12 571.10 1.00-564.63 -85.69 -1.00 0.00
2,900.00 15.31 188.63 2,813.34 598.35 1.00-591.57 -89.78 -1.00 0.00
3,000.00 14.31 188.63 2,910.01 623.91 1.00-616.85 -93.62 -1.00 0.00
3,100.00 13.31 188.63 3,007.12 647.79 1.00-640.46 -97.20 -1.00 0.00
3,200.00 12.31 188.63 3,104.63 669.97 1.00-662.38 -100.53 -1.00 0.00

3,300.00 11.31 188.63 3,202.51 690.44 1.00-682.62 -103.60 -1.00 0.00
3,400.00 10.31 188.63 3,300.73 709.20 1.00-701.17 -106.42 -1.00 0.00
3,500.00 9.31 188.63 3,399.27 726.25 1.00-718.02 -108.98 -1.00 0.00
3,600.00 8.31 188.63 3,498.08 741.57 1.00-733.17 -111.27 -1.00 0.00
3,700.00 7.31 188.63 3,597.15 755.16 1.00-746.61 -113.31 -1.00 0.00

3,800.00 6.31 188.63 3,696.45 767.03 1.00-758.34 -115.09 -1.00 0.00
3,900.00 5.31 188.63 3,795.93 777.16 1.00-768.36 -116.61 -1.00 0.00
4,000.00 4.31 188.63 3,895.58 785.55 1.00-776.65 -117.87 -1.00 0.00
4,100.00 3.31 188.63 3,995.35 792.20 1.00-783.23 -118.87 -1.00 0.00
4,200.00 2.31 188.63 4,095.23 797.11 1.00-788.08 -119.61 -1.00 0.00

4,300.00 1.31 188.63 4,195.18 800.27 1.00-791.21 -120.08 -1.00 0.00
4,400.00 0.31 188.63 4,295.17 801.69 1.00-792.62 -120.30 -1.00 0.00
4,431.38 0.00 0.00 4,326.55 801.78 1.00-792.70 -120.31 -1.00 0.00
4,500.00 0.00 0.00 4,395.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
4,600.00 0.00 0.00 4,495.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

4,700.00 0.00 0.00 4,595.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
4,800.00 0.00 0.00 4,695.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
4,900.00 0.00 0.00 4,795.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
5,000.00 0.00 0.00 4,895.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
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API Well Number: 43047517310000
EOG RESOURCES INC.

Planning Report

Database: EDM Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well 1544-26D
Company: Denver Division - Utah TVD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)
Project: T9S-R22E Sec 26 MD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)
Site: CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1 CWU 905-26 Se North Reference: True
Well: 1544-26D Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: APD

Planned Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (deg) (deg) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°I100ft) (°l100ft) (°I100ft)

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
100.00 0.00 0.00 100.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
200.00 0.00 0.00 200.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
300.00 0.00 0.00 300.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
400.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

500.00 1.50 188.63 499.99 -1.29 -0.20 1.31 1.50 1.50 0.00
600.00 3.00 188.63 599.91 -5.18 -0.79 5.23 1.50 1.50 0.00
700.00 4.50 188.63 699.69 -11.64 -1.77 11.77 1.50 1.50 0.00
800.00 6.00 188.63 799.27 -20.69 -3.14 20.92 1.50 1.50 0.00
900.00 7.50 188.63 898.57 -32.31 -4.90 32.68 1.50 1.50 0.00

1,000.00 9.00 188.63 997.54 -46.49 -7.06 47.03 1.50 1.50 0.00
1,100.00 10.50 188.63 1,096.09 -63.24 -9.60 63.96 1.50 1.50 0.00
1,200.00 12.00 188.63 1,194.16 -82.52 -12.52 83.47 1.50 1.50 0.00
1,300.00 13.50 188.63 1,291.70 -104.34 -15.84 105.54 1.50 1.50 0.00
1,400.00 15.00 188.63 1,388.62 -128.68 -19.53 130.15 1.50 1.50 0.00

1,500.00 16.50 188.63 1,484.86 -155.52 -23.60 157.30 1.50 1.50 0.00
1,600.00 18.00 188.63 1,580.36 -184.83 -28.05 186.95 1.50 1.50 0.00
1,666.67 19.00 188.63 1,643.58 -205.75 -31.23 208.10 1.50 1.50 0.00
1,700.00 19.00 188.63 1,675.10 -216.48 -32.85 218.96 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,800.00 19.00 188.63 1,769.65 -248.66 -37.74 251.51 0.00 0.00 0.00

1,900.00 19.00 188.63 1,864.20 -280.85 -42.63 284.07 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,000.00 19.00 188.63 1,958.75 -313.04 -47.51 316.63 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,100.00 19.00 188.63 2,053.30 -345.23 -52.40 349.18 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,200.00 19.00 188.63 2,147.86 -377.42 -57.28 381.74 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,300.00 19.00 188.63 2,242.41 -409.61 -62.17 414.30 0.00 0.00 0.00

2,400.00 19.00 188.63 2,336.96 -441.79 -67.05 446.85 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,500.00 19.00 188.63 2,431.51 -473.98 -71.94 479.41 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,531.37 19.00 188.63 2,461.17 -484.08 -73.47 489.62 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,600.00 18.31 188.63 2,526.20 -505.79 -76.76 511.58 1.00 -1.00 0.00
2,700.00 17.31 188.63 2,621.40 -536.03 -81.35 542.17 1.00 -1.00 0.00

2,800.00 16.31 188.63 2,717.12 -564.63 -85.69 571.10 1.00 -1.00 0.00
2,900.00 15.31 188.63 2,813.34 -591.57 -89.78 598.35 1.00 -1.00 0.00
3,000.00 14.31 188.63 2,910.01 -616.85 -93.62 623.91 1.00 -1.00 0.00
3,100.00 13.31 188.63 3,007.12 -640.46 -97.20 647.79 1.00 -1.00 0.00
3,200.00 12.31 188.63 3,104.63 -662.38 -100.53 669.97 1.00 -1.00 0.00

3,300.00 11.31 188.63 3,202.51 -682.62 -103.60 690.44 1.00 -1.00 0.00
3,400.00 10.31 188.63 3,300.73 -701.17 -106.42 709.20 1.00 -1.00 0.00
3,500.00 9.31 188.63 3,399.27 -718.02 -108.98 726.25 1.00 -1.00 0.00
3,600.00 8.31 188.63 3,498.08 -733.17 -111.27 741.57 1.00 -1.00 0.00
3,700.00 7.31 188.63 3,597.15 -746.61 -113.31 755.16 1.00 -1.00 0.00

3,800.00 6.31 188.63 3,696.45 -758.34 -115.09 767.03 1.00 -1.00 0.00
3,900.00 5.31 188.63 3,795.93 -768.36 -116.61 777.16 1.00 -1.00 0.00
4,000.00 4.31 188.63 3,895.58 -776.65 -117.87 785.55 1.00 -1.00 0.00
4,100.00 3.31 188.63 3,995.35 -783.23 -118.87 792.20 1.00 -1.00 0.00
4,200.00 2.31 188.63 4,095.23 -788.08 -119.61 797.11 1.00 -1.00 0.00

4,300.00 1.31 188.63 4,195.18 -791.21 -120.08 800.27 1.00 -1.00 0.00
4,400.00 0.31 188.63 4,295.17 -792.62 -120.30 801.69 1.00 -1.00 0.00
4,431.38 0.00 0.00 4,326.55 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 1.00 -1.00 0.00
4,500.00 0.00 0.00 4,395.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,600.00 0.00 0.00 4,495.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00

4,700.00 0.00 0.00 4,595.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,800.00 0.00 0.00 4,695.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,900.00 0.00 0.00 4,795.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,000.00 0.00 0.00 4,895.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
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Project:

Company:

Local Co-ordinate Reference:

TVD Reference:

Site:

Denver Division - Utah

T9S-R22E Sec 26

CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1_CWU 905-26_Set 13)

EOG RESOURCES INC.
Planning Report

Well:

Wellbore:

1544-26D

Wellbore #1

Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature

RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)

Design: APD

Database: EDM

MD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)

North Reference:

Well 1544-26D

True

Measured

Depth

(ft)
Inclination

(deg)

Azimuth

(deg)

+E/-W

(ft)

Vertical

Section

(ft)

Dogleg

Rate

(°/100ft)
+N/-S

(ft)

Build

Rate

(°/100ft)

Turn

Rate

(°/100ft)

Planned Survey

Vertical 

Depth

(ft)

5,100.00 0.00 0.00 4,995.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

5,200.00 0.00 0.00 5,095.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
5,300.00 0.00 0.00 5,195.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
5,400.00 0.00 0.00 5,295.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
5,500.00 0.00 0.00 5,395.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
5,600.00 0.00 0.00 5,495.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

5,700.00 0.00 0.00 5,595.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
5,800.00 0.00 0.00 5,695.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
5,900.00 0.00 0.00 5,795.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
6,000.00 0.00 0.00 5,895.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
6,100.00 0.00 0.00 5,995.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

6,200.00 0.00 0.00 6,095.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
6,300.00 0.00 0.00 6,195.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
6,400.00 0.00 0.00 6,295.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
6,500.00 0.00 0.00 6,395.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
6,600.00 0.00 0.00 6,495.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

6,700.00 0.00 0.00 6,595.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
6,800.00 0.00 0.00 6,695.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
6,900.00 0.00 0.00 6,795.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
7,000.00 0.00 0.00 6,895.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
7,100.00 0.00 0.00 6,995.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

7,104.83 0.00 0.00 7,000.00 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

CWU 1544-26D
7,200.00 0.00 0.00 7,095.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
7,300.00 0.00 0.00 7,195.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
7,400.00 0.00 0.00 7,295.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
7,500.00 0.00 0.00 7,395.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

7,600.00 0.00 0.00 7,495.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
7,700.00 0.00 0.00 7,595.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
7,800.00 0.00 0.00 7,695.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
7,900.00 0.00 0.00 7,795.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
8,000.00 0.00 0.00 7,895.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

8,100.00 0.00 0.00 7,995.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
8,200.00 0.00 0.00 8,095.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
8,300.00 0.00 0.00 8,195.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
8,400.00 0.00 0.00 8,295.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
8,500.00 0.00 0.00 8,395.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

8,600.00 0.00 0.00 8,495.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
8,700.00 0.00 0.00 8,595.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
8,800.00 0.00 0.00 8,695.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
8,900.00 0.00 0.00 8,795.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
9,000.00 0.00 0.00 8,895.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00

9,100.00 0.00 0.00 8,995.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
9,200.00 0.00 0.00 9,095.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
9,300.00 0.00 0.00 9,195.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
9,400.00 0.00 0.00 9,295.17 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
9,414.83 0.00 0.00 9,310.00 801.78 0.00-792.70 -120.31 0.00 0.00
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API Well Number: 43047517310000
EOG RESOURCES INC.

Planning Report

Database: EDM Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well 1544-26D
Company: Denver Division - Utah TVD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)
Project: T9S-R22E Sec 26 MD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)
Site: CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1 CWU 905-26 Se North Reference: True
Well: 1544-26D Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: APD

Planned Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (deg) (deg) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°I100ft) (°l100ft) (°I100ft)

5,100.00 0.00 0.00 4,995.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,200.00 0.00 0.00 5,095.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,300.00 0.00 0.00 5,195.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,400.00 0.00 0.00 5,295.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,500.00 0.00 0.00 5,395.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,600.00 0.00 0.00 5,495.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00

5,700.00 0.00 0.00 5,595.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,800.00 0.00 0.00 5,695.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,900.00 0.00 0.00 5,795.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,000.00 0.00 0.00 5,895.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,100.00 0.00 0.00 5,995.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,200.00 0.00 0.00 6,095.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,300.00 0.00 0.00 6,195.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,400.00 0.00 0.00 6,295.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,500.00 0.00 0.00 6,395.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,600.00 0.00 0.00 6,495.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00

6,700.00 0.00 0.00 6,595.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,800.00 0.00 0.00 6,695.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,900.00 0.00 0.00 6,795.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,000.00 0.00 0.00 6,895.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,100.00 0.00 0.00 6,995.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00

7,104.83 0.00 0.00 7,000.00 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
CWU 1544-26D

7,200.00 0.00 0.00 7,095.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,300.00 0.00 0.00 7,195.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,400.00 0.00 0.00 7,295.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,500.00 0.00 0.00 7,395.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00

7,600.00 0.00 0.00 7,495.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,700.00 0.00 0.00 7,595.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,800.00 0.00 0.00 7,695.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,900.00 0.00 0.00 7,795.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,000.00 0.00 0.00 7,895.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00

8,100.00 0.00 0.00 7,995.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,200.00 0.00 0.00 8,095.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,300.00 0.00 0.00 8,195.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,400.00 0.00 0.00 8,295.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,500.00 0.00 0.00 8,395.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00

8,600.00 0.00 0.00 8,495.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,700.00 0.00 0.00 8,595.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,800.00 0.00 0.00 8,695.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,900.00 0.00 0.00 8,795.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
9,000.00 0.00 0.00 8,895.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00

9,100.00 0.00 0.00 8,995.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
9,200.00 0.00 0.00 9,095.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
9,300.00 0.00 0.00 9,195.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
9,400.00 0.00 0.00 9,295.17 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
9,414.83 0.00 0.00 9,310.00 -792.70 -120.31 801.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
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Project:

Company:

Local Co-ordinate Reference:

TVD Reference:

Site:

Denver Division - Utah

T9S-R22E Sec 26

CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1_CWU 905-26_Set 13)

EOG RESOURCES INC.
Planning Report

Well:

Wellbore:

1544-26D

Wellbore #1

Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature

RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)

Design: APD

Database: EDM

MD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)

North Reference:

Well 1544-26D

True

Target Name

     - hit/miss target

     - Shape
TVD

(ft)

Northing

(ft)

Easting

(ft)

+N/-S

(ft)

+E/-W

(ft)

Targets

LongitudeLatitude

Dip Angle

(deg)

Dip Dir.

(deg)

CWU 1544-26D 7,000.00 -110,372.71 2,588,516.96-792.70 -120.310.00 0.00 40° 0' 39.126 N 109° 23' 57.445 W
- plan hits target center
- Circle (radius 50.00)
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API Well Number: 43047517310000
EOG RESOURCES INC.

Planning Report

Database: EDM Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well 1544-26D
Company: Denver Division - Utah TVD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)
Project: T9S-R22E Sec 26 MD Reference: RIG @ 5034.00ft (True 34)
Site: CWU 1541-1546 26D (Pad D1 CWU 905-26 Se North Reference: True
Well: 1544-26D Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: APD

Targets

Target Name
- hit/miss target Dip Angle Dip Dir. TVD +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting
- Shape (deg) (deg) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

CWU 1544-26D 0.00 0.00 7,000.00 -792.70 -120.31
-110,372.71 2,588,516.96 40° O' 39.126 N 109° 23' 57.445 W

- plan hits target center
- Circle (radius 50.00)

9/21/2010 2:38:34PM Page 5 COMPASS 2003.21 Build



API Well Number: 43047517310000

eog resources

Chapita We/Is Unit 1541-260 through 1546-260
Surface Use Plan

Section 26, T9S, R22E
Uintah County, Utah

EOG Resources, Inc.'s (EOG) conventional oil/gas wells are located approximately 51.3miles south of Vernal, Utah withinUintah County. This project consists of six (6) new wells tobe constructed on the existing wellpad for Chapita Wells Unit905-26, and Chapita Wells Unit36-26.

The proposed wells are located on federal surface. Title to the oil and gas mineral interestis federally owned and is administeredby the Vernal Field Officeof the Bureau of Land
Management (BLM).

The proposed wells are conventionalgas wells producing from the Mesaverde formation.Unproductive drill holes willbe plugged and abandoned as soon as evaluation of the productionintervals is conclusive.

This projectapplies to the following new proposedwells.
Well Name & Number QTR Section Township Range Total DepthChapita We\\s Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1541-26D
Chapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1542-26D
Chapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1543-26D
Chapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1544-26D
Chapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1545-26D
Chapita Wells Unit NENE 26 9S 22E1546-26D

The proposed action is to directionally drill five conventional gas wells to the Mesaverde
formation.
The proposed action involves:

Activity Length (ft) Width (ft) Acres of Disturbance
Existing Disturbance 270 180 2.469

New Disturbance 300 70 0.48
Cut/fills& Topsoil/spoil

Varies Variesstockpile
Access Road Existing Existing 0Total New Disturbance



API Well Number: 43047517310000
Chapita We/Is Unit 1541-260 through 1546-26D
Surface Use Plan Page 2

EOG willbuildeach pad to accommodate up to six wells. The acres of disturbance providedabove are the maximum disturbance expectedfor each pad.

The proposed well locations require the construction of six (6) engineered (cut & fill) well pads.The total surface disturbance associated with the construction of these locations isapproximately 2.95 acres. This figure includes disturbance associated with the well pads, thespoil and topsoilsstorage areas, and the constructionequipment and vehicle disturbance.

1. EXISTING ROADS:

Refer to Sheet # 4 and Sheet # 5 for location of existing access roads.

The proposed locations are approximately 50.8 miles from Vernal, Utah.

Directions to the proposed locations are provided on the front page of the location plats.
The existing roads willbe maintained in the same or better condition as existed prior to thecommencement ofoperations. Maintenance of the roads to the proposed locations willcontinue untilabandonment and reclamation of the wells.

A federal road right of way is not required, UintahCounty roads and authorizedUnit roadswillbe used to access the proposed wellsite.

2. Access Roads to be Constructed:

No new roads willbe required to access the proposed wellsite.

Roads and associated drainage structureswillbe maintained in accordance withguidelinescontained in the jointBLM/USFSpublication: Surface Operating Standards for Oiland GasExploration and Development, Fourth Edition, and/or BLM Manual Section 9113 concerningroad construction standards on projects subject to federal jurisdiction.During the drillingand production phase of operations, the road surface and shoulderswillbe kept in a safeand useable condition and drainage ditches and culverts willbe kept clear and free flowing.

If existing access road, proposed access road and/or well pad are dry during construction,drilling and/or completion activities,water will be applied to help facilitate compaction duringconstruction and to minimizesoil loss as a result of wind erosion.

3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHINA ONE-MILE ÑADIUS:

Please refer to Topo C for the location of existing wells withina one-mile radius of theproposed wells.

4. LOCATION OF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED PRODUCTION EACILITIES:

See the proposed Production Facility Layout diagrams showing the proposed production
facilities to be utilizedon Figure 3.

Allproduction facilities willbe located on the disturbed portion of the well pad and at aminimumof25 feet from the toe of the back slope.

AIIpermanent (on site for six months or longer) structures constructed or installed



API Well Number: 43047517310000
Chapita Wells Unit 1541-26D through 1546-26D
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pumping units)willbe painted a flat, non-reflective,earthtonecolorto matchone ofthe
standard environmentalcolors,as determined by the Rocky Mountain Five State
Interagency Committee. Allfacilitieswillbe painted within6 months of installation.AII
facilities will be painted with Carlsbad Canyon. Facilities required to complywith
O.S.H.A. (Occupational Safety and Health Act) willbe excluded

Containment berms willbe constructedcompletelyaround production facilitiesdesigned to
hold fluids (i.e., production tanks, produced watertanks, and/orheater/treater). The
containmentberms willbe constructedofcompactedsubsoil,be sufficientlyimpervious, hold
110 percent ofthe capacityof the largest tank, and be independent ofthe back cut.

Allsafety measures have been considered in the design, construction,operation,and
maintenanceof the facility. EOG willhave a designated representativepresent during
construction.Any accidentsto persons or property on federal lands willimmediately be
reported to the Authorized Officer.

Production facilities will be set on location if the wells are successfully completed for
production. Facilities willconsist of wellheadvalves, comboseparator-dehyunitwith meter,
two (2) to eight (8) 400-bbi and one (1) 300-bbl vertical tanks and attachingpiping.

Gas gathering lines -· A 4" gathering line willbe buried from dehy to the edge ofthe location.

5. LOCA710N AND TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY:

Water supplywillbe Bonanza Power Plant watersource in Sec 26, T8S, R23E, Uintah
County, UT (State Water Right # 49-225(A31368)).

Water willbe hauled by a licensed truckingcompany.

No water wellwillbe drilledon lease.

6. SOURCE OF ÛONSTRUCTION MATERIALS:

Any constructionmaterialsthat may be required for surfacingof thedrillpads and access
roads willbe obtainedfrom a contractorhaving a permitted source of materials withinthe
general area.

No construction materialswillbe removed from Federal or Indian lands withoutprior
approval from the appropriatesurface management agency.

7. METHODS OF HANDLINGWASTE DISPOSAL:

Cuttings and drilling fluids willbe containedwithin the closed loop system. Cutting willbe
dried on site hauled to an authorizeddisposal site and/or spread on the access road and
well pad.

Fracture stimulationfluids willbe flowed back into (above ground tanks) closed loop system
and hauled to a DEQ authorizeddisposal site

A portable toiletwillbe provided for human waste during the drillingand completionof the
well. Disposal willbe at an authorized
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well.Disposal willbe at an authorizedsite.

All garbage and non-flammable waste materials will be contained in a self-contained,portable dumpster or trash cage. Upon completionof operations, or as needed, theaccumulatedtrash willbe transportedto a state approvedwaste disposal site. No trash willbe placed in the reserve pit.

Immediately after removal of the drilling rig, all debris and other waste materials notcontained in the trash cage will be cleaned up and removed from the location. Nopotentiallyadverse materials or substances willbe left on the location. Any open pits willbefenced during drillingoperationsand said fencing willbe maintained untilsuch time as thepits have been backfilled.

EOG Resources, Inc. maintainsa file, per 29 CFR 1910.1200 (g)containingcurrentMaterialSafety Data Sheets (MSDS) for all chemicals,compounds, and/or substances whichareused during the course of construction,drilling,completion,and production operationsforthis project. Hazardous materials(substances)which may be found at the site may includedrilling mud and cementing products which are primarily inhalation hazards, fuels(flammable and/or combustible),materials that may be necessary for well completion/stimulation activities such as flammable or combustible substances and acids/gels(corrosives). The opportunityfor Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization Act (SARA)listed Extremely Hazardous Substances (EHS) at the site is generally limitedto proprietarytreatingchemicals. All hazardous and EHS and commercialpreparations willbe handled inan appropriatemanner to minimizethe potential for leaks or spillsto the environment.
8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES:

None anticipated.

9. WELL SITE LAYouT:

See the attached diagrams showingthe proposed drillpad cross sectionsand cut and fills inrelation to topographicfeatures as wellas access ontothe pad and soilstockpiles.
All equipmentand vehicles will be confinedto the approved disturbed areas of this APD(i.e., access road, well pad, and spoiland topsoilstorage areas).
Ifnecessary, in order to divert surface runoff,a drainage ditch willbe constructedaroundtheupslope side ofthe well site.

The fillsectionof the pad that supports the drillingrig and any other heavy equipmentwillbecompacted.

Closed Loop System:

The closed loop system willbe installed in a manner that preventing leaks, breaks, ordischarge. Drillcuttingwillbe containedin an area approximately50' x 100'. The surfacedrillcuttingspile willbe bermed and lined withbentonite. Drillcuttingswillbe dried andspread on location. More stringentprotective requirements may be deemed necessary bythe A.O.

The closed loop system will be constructed in a way that minimizes the accumulation
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surface precipitation runoff into the cuttingscontainmentarea. This may be accomplishedby appropriateplacement of subsoilltopsoilstorage areas and/or constructionof berms orditches.

The closed loop system willbe fenced on three sides during drillingoperations and thefourth side will be fenced after the drilling rig moves off the location. This fence will beeither: (1) woven wire at least 28 inches high and within4 inches of ground surface with 2strands of barbed wire above the wovenwire with 10 inch spacing,or (2) at least 4 strandsof barbed wire spaced, starting from the ground, at approximately6, 8, 10, and 12 inchintervals.

Siphons, catchments,drip pans, and absorbentpads willbe installed to keep hydrocarbonsproduced by the drilling and/or completionrigs from entering the closed loop system.Hydrocarbons and contaminatedpads will be disposed of in accordance with Utah DEQrequirements.

10.PLANS FOR RECLAMATION OF THESURFACE:

A. Interim Reclamation:

Rat and mouse holes willbe filled andcompactedfrom bottom to top immediately uponrelease of the drillingrig from the location.

Topsoil from the berms and/orstorage piles willbe spread alongthe road's cut and fillslopes. Drainage ditches or culvertswillnot be blocked withtopsoiland associatedorganicmatter. The unused area ofthe pad willbe recontoured and topsoilspread sixinches deep. The area on the contourwillbe ripped one foot deep usingripperteeth seton one-footcenters. The topsoilareas and reclaimed area of the wellpad willbeseeded as stated below.

All disturbed areas willbe seeded usinga drillequippedwitha depth regulator. Allseedwillbe drilledon the contour. The seed willbe planted between one-quarter and one-
half inch deep. Where drillingis not possible (i.e., too steep or rocky),the seed willbebroadcast and the area raked or chainedto coverthe seed. Ifthe seed mixtureis
broadcast, the rate willbe doubled. EOG willuse a seed mixtureand applicationrateapprovedby the landowners.

Seeding willbe done in compliancewithEOG's approvedreclamation plan.
Seeding shallbe repeated untila satisfactorystand, as determined by the authorizedofficer,is obtained. The first evaluationofgrowth willbe made following completionofthe first growing season after seeding.

The average size ofthe pads after reclamation is approximately1.39 to 2.00 acres (seethe attached Production FacilityLayout).

B. Final Reclamation:

Upon finalabandonmentof the well, EOG willsubmita sundrynotice describing theproposed reclamation plan for approvalby the Authorized Officer.

Configurationofthe re-shaped topographywillbe returned,as near as possible, to theoriginalcondition.Cut and fillslopes willbe 3 to 1 or less. All topsoilwillbe re-strippedfrom interim reclamation and redistributed overthe entire location. The entire
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The reclaimed locations and access roads willbe re-seeded withthe recommended
seed mixture.

Monitoring willbe conductedby a qualifiedOperator representative (in coordinationwith
the BLM)followinginitial rehabilitationwork. Monitoringareas willbe re-examined at the
end ofthe first growing season. Results willbe documented in a report to the BLM.
Problem areas identifiedduring monitoringwillreceivefollow-uprehabilitation/erosion
controlmeasures. The seeding shallbe repeated untila satisfactorystand, as
determined by the authorizedofficer,is obtained.

11.SURFACE OWNERSHIP:

Surface ownershipofthe proposed wellsites, is as follows:

Bureau of Land Management

12.OTHER INFORMATION:

All lease and/or unit operationswillbe conductedin such a manner that fullcomplianceis
made withallapplicablelaws, regulations, Onshore Oiland Gas Orders, the approvedPlan
ofOperations, and any applicableNotice of Lessees. The operator is fullyresponsible for
the actionsof its subcontractors. A completecopyofthe approved"Applicationfor Permit to
Drill"willbe furnished to the field representative(s) to ensure complianceand shallbe on
location during allconstructionand drillingoperations.

Weeds willbe controlledon disturbed areas withinthe exteriorlimits ofthe access road and
wellpad. The controlmethods shallbe in accordance withguidelines establishedby the
EPA, BLM,state, and local authorities. Approval willbe obtainedfrom the Authorized
Officerprior to use of pesticides.

EOG willinform allpersons in the area who are associated with this project that they may be
subjectto prosecution for knowinglydisturbing historic or archaeologicalsites or for
collectingartifacts. Ifhistoric or archaeologicalmaterials are uncovered during construction,
the operatorwillimmediately stop work that mightfurther disturb such materials and contact
the Authorized officer. If the operatorwishes, at any time,to relocate activitiesto avoidthe
expense of mitigationand/orthe delays associated with this process, the Authorized Officer
willassume responsibilityfor whatever recordation and stabilizationof the exposed
materials may be required. Otherwise the operatorwillbe responsible for mitigationcosts.
The Authorized Officerwillprovide technicaland procedural guidelines for the conductof
mitigation. Upon verificationfrom the Authorized Officerthat required mitigationhas been
completed,the operatorwillthen be allowedto resume construction.

A culturalresources surveywas conductedand submittedby MontgomeryArchaeological
Consultants on 7/11/2007. A paleontological surveywas conductedand submittedby
Intermountain Paleo on
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LESSEE OR ÛPERATOR'SREPRESENTATIVE AND ÛERTIFICATION:

PERMITTINGAGENT
Kaylene R. Gardner
EOG Resources, Inc.
1060 East Highway 40
Vernal, UT 84078
(435) 781-9111

Alllease and/orunit operationswillbe conducted in such a mannerthat full complianceismade withallapplicablelaws, regulations, Onshore Oiland Gas Orders, the approvedplanof operations,andanyapplicableNotice to Lessees. The operatoris fully responsiblefor theactionsofhis subcontractors.A copyofthese conditionswillbe furnished to the fieldrepresentative to insure compliance.

The operatoror his/her contractorshallcontactthe BLMofficeat (435) 781-4400 forty-eight
(48) hours prior to construction
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CERTIFICATION:

I hereby certifythat I, or persons undermydirect supervision,have inspected the proposeddrill site and access route;that I am familiarwiththeconditionswhich currentlyexist;that thestatements made in this plan are, to the best of myknowledge, true and correct;and that theworkassociated withthe operationsproposed herein willbe performed by EOG Resources,Inc. and its contractorsand subcontractorsin conformitywiththis plan and the termsandconditionsunderwhichit is approved. This statement is subjectto the provisions of 18U.S.C. 1001 for the filingofa false statement.

Please be advisedthat EOG Resources, Inc. is consideredto be the operatorofthe
referenced wells, located in the NENE,of Section 26, T9S, R22E, Uintah County, Utah;
Federal land and minerals;and is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the leasefor the operationsconducteduponthe leased lands. Bon Coverage is under Bond # NM
2308.

D r. ulatoW
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EOG RESOURCES 11" 5,000 PSI W.P. BOP
CONFIGURATION PAGE 1 OF 2

A

NUL
VEN

,
-5.

D -

4-lita-s,000 4-1Ii6"S,000
HCRVALVE MANUALVALVE kn 2-1/18"S,000 2-1/16"B,000

MANUALVALVEB CHECKVALVE

4"5,000 PSI r
20KE LINE r

TOMMIFOLD

" 5
FMCDRIU.ING

CONNECTOR,11
5,000 x DTOPREP

FMemtrastry
sowxs,ooow.P.

13-3/8"



API Well Number: 43047517310000

EOG RESOURCES CHOKE MANIFOLD CONFIGURATIO PAGE20F2
W/ 5,000 PSI WP VALVES

3" MIN.IDTO 3" MIN.ID BLEED 3" MIN.IDTO
SEPARATOR, OR PIT LINETO PIT SEPARATOR, OR PIT

MANUAL
CHOKE

ADJUSTABLE

4" 5,000 PSI CHOKE
LINE FROMHCR

VALVE

Testing Procedure:
1. BOP will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2.
2. Blind and Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5,000 psi.
3. Annular Preventer will be tested to 50% working pressure, 2,500 psi.

Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi / ft. or 1,500 psi. Not to exceed 70% of burst strength,
whichever is greater.

4. All lines subject to well pressure will be tested to the same pressure as blind and pipe rams.
5. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2
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Well Name: Chapita Wells Unit 1544-26D
API Number: 4304751731
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 United States Department of the Interior 
 
 BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 
 Utah State Office 
 P.O. Box 45155 
 Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155 
 
IN REPLY REFER TO: 
3160 
(UT-922) 
    
       August 3, 2011 
Memorandum 
 
To:     Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District 
 
From:    Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer 
 
Subject: 2011 Plan of Development Chapita Wells Unit 

Uintah County, Utah. 
 
Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and 
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land 
Management, the following wells are planned for calendar year 
2011 within the Chapita Wells Unit, Uintah County, Utah. 
  
     API #                                 WELL NAME                                                          LOCATION 
 
 (Proposed PZ MESA VERDE) 
 
43-047-51741 CWU 1543-26D   Sec 26 T09S R22E 0447 FNL 0491 FEL 
              BHL Sec 26 T09S R22E 0857 FNL 0210 FEL 
 
43-047-51731 CWU 1544-26D   Sec 26 T09S R22E 0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
              BHL Sec 26 T09S R22E 1240 FNL 0624 FEL 
 
43-047-51739 CWU 1546-26D   Sec 26 T09S R22E 0445 FNL 0531 FEL 
              BHL Sec 26 T09S R22E 0639 FNL 1255 FEL 
 
43-047-51740 CWU 1545-26D   Sec 26 T09S R22E 0446 FNL 0521 FEL 
              BHL Sec 26 T09S R22E 0923 FNL 0936 FEL 
 
 
This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this 
time. 
 
       
 
 
 
bcc: File - Chapita Wells Unit 
 Division of Oil Gas and Mining 
 Central Files 
 Agr. Sec. Chron 
 Fluid Chron 
 
MCoulthard:mc:8-3-11 

Division of Oil Gas and Mining

Michael L. Coulthard
Digitally signed by Michael L. Coulthard 
DN: cn=Michael L. Coulthard, o=Bureau of Land Management, 
ou=Branch of Minerals, email=Michael_Coulthard@blm.gov, c=US 
Date: 2011.08.03 11:43:26 -06'00'

API Well Number: 43047517310000

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
(UT-922)

August 3, 2011
Memorandum

To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2011 Plan of Development Chapita Wells Unit
Uintah County, Utah .

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management, the following wells are planned for calendar year
2011 within the Chapita Wells Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ MESA VERDE)

43-047-51741 CWU 1543-26D Sec 26 TO9S R22E 0447 FNL 0491 FEL
BHL Sec 26 TO9S R22E 0857 FNL 0210 FEL

43-047-51731 CWU 1544-26D Sec 26 TO9S R22E 0447 FNL 0501 FEL
BHL Sec 26 TO9S R22E 1240 FNL 0624 FEL

43-047-51739 CWU 1546-26D Sec 26 TO9S R22E 0445 FNL 0531 FEL
BHL Sec 26 TO9S R22E 0639 FNL 1255 FEL

43-047-51740 CWU 1545-26D Sec 26 TO9S R22E 0446 FNL 0521 FEL
BHL Sec 26 TO9S R22E 0923 FNL 0936 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this
time .

Digitally signed by Michael L. Coulthard

h I IthdMiC Lae ng | DN:cn=MichaelL.Coulthard,o=BureauofLandManagement,
. Lu u a i ou=Branch of Minerals, email=Michael_Coulthard@blm.gov, c=US

Date:2011.08.0311:43:26-06'00'

bcc: File - Chapita Wells Unit
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron

MCoulthard:mc:



WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 6/24/2011 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43047517310000

WELL NAME: Chapita Wells Unit 1544-26D   

OPERATOR: EOG Resources, Inc. (N9550) PHONE NUMBER: 435 781-9145

CONTACT: Mickenzie Gates   

PROPOSED LOCATION: NENE 26 090S 220E Permit Tech Review:

SURFACE: 0447 FNL 0501 FEL Engineering Review:

BOTTOM: 1240 FNL 0624 FEL Geology Review:

COUNTY: UINTAH 

LATITUDE: 40.01307 LONGITUDE: -109.39879

UTM SURF EASTINGS: 636659.00 NORTHINGS: 4430226.00

FIELD NAME: NATURAL BUTTES   

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal   

LEASE NUMBER: UTU0285A             PROPOSED PRODUCING FORMATION(S): MESA VERDE 

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE: NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

PLAT R649-2-3.

Bond: FEDERAL - NM2308      Unit:  CHAPITA WELLS 

Potash R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5      

Oil Shale 190-3 R649-3-3. Exception

Oil Shale 190-13  Drilling Unit 

Water Permit: 49-225           Board Cause No:  Cause 179-08

RDCC Review:           Effective Date:  8/10/1999

Fee Surface Agreement           Siting:  Suspends General Siting

Intent to Commingle R649-3-11. Directional Drill

 Commingling Approved  

Comments:          Presite Completed
                  

Stipulations:         4 - Federal Approval - dmason
                             15 - Directional - dmason
                             17 - Oil Shale 190-5(b) - dmason

API Well Number: 43047517310000

WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

I

I

APD RECEIVED: 6/24/2011 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43047517310000

WELL NAME: Chapita Wells Unit 1544-26D

OPERATOR: EOG Resources, Inc. (N9550) PHONE NUMBER: 435 781-9145

CONTACT: Mickenzie Gates

PROPOSED LOCATION: NENE 26 0905 220E Permit Tech Review:

SURFACE: 0447 FNL 0501 FEL Engineering Review:

BOTTOM: 1240 FNL 0624 FEL Geology Review:

COUNTY: UINTAH

LATITUDE: 40.01307 LONGITUDE: -109.39879

UTM SURF EASTINGS: 636659.00 NORTHINGS: 4430226.00

FIELD NAME: NATURAL BUTTES

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: UTUO285A PROPOSED PRODUCING FORMATION(S): MESA VERDE

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE: NO

I

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

PLAT R649-2-3.

Bond: FEDERAL - NM2308 Unit: CHAPITA WELLS

Potash R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5

Oil Shale 190-3 R649-3-3. Exception

Oil Shale 190-13 Drilling Unit

Water Permit: 49-225 Board Cause No: Cause 179-08

RDCC Review: Effective Date: 8/10/1999

Fee Surface Agreement Siting: Suspends General Siting

Intent to Commingle R649-3-11. Directional Drill

Commingling Approved

I

Comments: Presite Completed

Stipulations: 4 - Federal Approval - dmason
15 - Directional - dmason
17 - Oil Shale 190-5(b) -



Permit To Drill

******************
Well Name:  Chapita Wells Unit 1544-26D

API Well Number:  43047517310000

Lease Number:  UTU0285A

Surface Owner:   FEDERAL 

Approval Date:  8/3/2011

Issued to:
EOG Resources, Inc., 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N, Denver, CO 80202

Authority:
Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. §40-6-1 et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit to drill the listed
well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of Cause 179-08. The expected
producing formation or pool is the MESA VERDE Formation(s), completion into any other zones
will require filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool
will require approval in accordance with R649-3-22.

Duration:
This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous operation
is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date

General:
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to drill.

Conditions of Approval:
State approval of this well does not supercede the required federal approval, which must be obtained
prior to drilling. 

In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit a
complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days following
completion of the well. 

In accordance with the Order in Cause No. 190-5(b) dated October 28, 1982, the operator shall
comply with the requirements of Rules R649-3-31 and R649-3-27 pertaining to Designated Oil Shale
Areas. Additionally, the operators shall ensure that the surface and or production casing is properly
cemented over the entire oil shale section as defined by Rule R649-3-31. The Operator shall report
the actual depth the oil shale is encountered to the division. 

Notification Requirements:
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following actions during
drilling of this well:
   • Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well – contact Carol Daniels at 801-538-5284
     (please leave a voicemail message if not available)

API Well No: 43047517310000API Well No: 43047517310000

State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

-/ MICHAEL R. STYLER

GAR . H BE RT
Exoutim Drotor

comrmr Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieuterant Gowrær Busion Director

Permit To Drill
kkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkk

Well Name: Chapita Wells Unit 1544-26D
API Well Number: 43047517310000

Lease Number: UTUO285A
Surface Owner: FEDERAL
Approval Date: 8/3/2011

Issued to:
EOG Resources, Inc., 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N, Denver, CO 80202

Authority:
Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. §40-6-1et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit to drill the listed
well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of Cause 179-08. The expected
producing formation or pool is the MESA VERDE Formation(s), completion into any other zones
will require filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool
will require approval in accordance with R649-3-22.

Duration:
This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous operation
is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date

General:
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to drill.

Conditions of Approval:
State approval of this well does not supercede the required federal approval, which must be obtained
prior to drilling.

In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit a
complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days following
completion of the well.

In accordance with the Order in Cause No. 190-5(b) dated October 28, 1982, the operator shall
comply with the requirements of Rules R649-3-31 and R649-3-27 pertaining to Designated Oil Shale
Areas. Additionally, the operators shall ensure that the surface and or production casing is properly
cemented over the entire oil shale section as defined by Rule R649-3-31. The Operator shall report
the actual depth the oil shale is encountered to the division.

Notification Requirements:
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following actions during
drilling of this well:

• Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well- contact Carol Daniels at 801-538-5284
(please leave a voicemail message if not



     OR
     submit an electronic sundry notice (pre-registration required) via the Utah Oil & Gas website
     at http://oilgas.ogm.utah.gov

Reporting Requirements:
All reports, forms and submittals as required by the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
will be promptly filed with the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, including but not limited to:
   • Entity Action Form (Form 6) – due within 5 days of spudding the well
   • Monthly Status Report (Form 9) – due by 5th day of the following calendar month
   • Requests to Change Plans (Form 9) – due prior to implementation
   • Written Notice of Emergency Changes (Form 9) – due within 5 days
   • Notice of Operations Suspension or Resumption (Form 9) – due prior to implementation
   • Report of Water Encountered (Form 7) – due within 30 days after completion
   • Well Completion Report (Form 8) – due within 30 days after completion or plugging

Approved By:

For John Rogers
Associate Director, Oil & Gas 

API Well No: 43047517310000API Well No: 43047517310000

OR
submit an electronic sundry notice (pre-registration required) via the Utah Oil & Gas website
at http://oilgas.ogm.utah.gov

Reporting Requirements:
All reports, forms and submittals as required by the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
will be promptly filed with the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, including but not limited to:

• Entity Action Form (Form 6) - due within 5 days of spudding the well
• Monthly Status Report (Form 9) - due by 5th day of the following calendar month
• Requests to Change Plans (Form 9) - due prior to implementation
• Written Notice of Emergency Changes (Form 9) - due within 5 days
• Notice of Operations Suspension or Resumption (Form 9) - due prior to implementation
• Report of Water Encountered (Form 7) - due within 30 days after completion
• Well Completion Report (Form 8) - due within 30 days after completion or plugging

Approved By:

For John Rogers
Associate Director, Oil &



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1544-26D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

12/8/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests authorization to change the Drilling
Plan as per the attached: Float Equipment: Item 5, Mud Program: Item 6 and

Cement Program: Item 9. 

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/8/2011

Dec. 08, 2011

Sundry Number: 21109 API Well Number: 43047517310000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEUAOS2E8D5ESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITA WELLS

1.TYPEOFYVELL 8.VVELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1544-26D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources,Inc. 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0447 FNL 0501 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.05 Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate clate work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

12/8/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests authorization to change the Drilling
Plan as per the attached: Float Equipment: Item 5, Mud Program: Item 6 and

Cement Program: Item 9.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



5.  Float Equipment: 
 

Surface Hole (0’- 2200’±) 

 
  Guide Shoe 
  Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable) 

Centralizers:  1 in middle of shoe joint, then top of every joint for next 7 joints.  (8 total) 

 
Production Hole (2200’± - TD): 

 
Float shoe, 1 joint of casing, float collar and balance of casing to surface.  4-½”, 11.6#, N-80 or equivalent marker 
collars or short casing joints to be placed at top of Price River and 400’ above top of Wasatch.  1 turbulizer to be 
placed 5’ above shoe on joint #1 and on the middle of joints #2 & #3.  Conventional bow-spring centralizer on top 
of joint #4, then every 3

rd
 joint to 400’ above the top of primary objective. Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of 

float collar, and top of 2
nd

 joint.   

 

6.   MUD PROGRAM 
 

 Surface Hole (Surface - 2200’±): 
  

                        Air/Air mist/Aerated water* (*A standby water source will be available at all times to act as a kill 
medium when conducting air drilling operations) 

 

  or 
 

A closed-loop system utilizing a gelled bentonite mud will be employed.  
LCM sweeps, additions, etc. will be used as necessary. 

 
Production Hole (2200’± - TD):   

 
Anticipated mud weight 9.5 – 10.5 ppg depending on actual wellbore conditions encountered 
while drilling. 

 
 A closed mud system will be utilized. A bentonite gelled water mud system will be used to control 

viscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay encapsulation/inhibition.  
Water loss will be maintained at <15 cc’s using white starch or PAC.  Bactericides will be used as 
needed.  Anticipated pH will range from 9.0-10.0.  Mud weight will be adjusted as necessary for 
well control.  Deflocculants/thinners will be used as necessary to maintain mud quality.  LCM 
sweeps will be utilized as necessary to control lost circulation and mud loss.  CO2 contamination, 
if encountered, will be treated with lime and gypsum. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Dec. 08, 2011

Sundry Number: 21109 API Well Number: 43047517310000

5. Float Equipment:

Surface Hole (0'-2200'±)

Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Centralizers: 1 in middle of shoe joint, then top of every joint for next 7 joints. (8 total)

Production Hole (2200'± - TD):

Float shoe, 1 joint of casing, float collar and balance of casing to surface. 4-½", 11.6#, N-80 or equivalent marker
collars or short casing joints to be placed at top of Price River and 400' above top of Wasatch. 1 turbulizer to be
placed 5' above shoe on joint #1 and on the middle of joints #2 & #3. Conventional bow-spring centralizer on top
of joint#4, then every 3rd

jOint to 400' above the top of primary objective. Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of
float collar, and top of 2nd

jOint.

6. MUD PROGRAM

Surface Hole (Surface - 2200'±):

Air/Airmist/Aerated water* (*Astandby water source will be available at all times to act as a kill
medium when conducting air drilling operations)

or
A closed-loop system utilizing a gelled bentonite mud will be employed.
LCM sweeps, additions, etc. will be used as necessary.

Production Hole (2200'± - TD):

Anticipated mud weight 9.5 - 10.5 ppg depending on actual wellbore conditions encountered
while drilling.

A closed mud system will be utilized. A bentonite gelled water mud system will be used to control
viscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay encapsulationlinhibition.
Water loss will be maintained at <15 cc's using white starch or PAC. Bactericides will be used as
needed. Anticipated pH will range from 9.0-10.0. Mud weight will be adjusted as necessary for
well control. Deflocculants/thinners will be used as necessary to maintain mud quality. LCM
sweeps will be utilized as necessary to control lost circulation and mud loss. CO2 contamination,
if encountered, will be treated with lime and



9.  CEMENT PROGRAM: 
 Surface Hole (Surface - 2200’±): 
 

Lead:  Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement from 500’ above casing shoe to surface.  Lead  

cement will be: 
 

130 sx.        HES VariCem (Type III) + 2% Cal-Seal (Thixotropic Additive) + 0.3% Versaset  
                    (Thixotropic Additive) + 2% Econolite (Light Weight Additive), mixed at 10.5 ppg,  
                     4.10 cfps, 26.88 gps fresh water 

 

Tail:   Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement 500’ above casing shoe.  Tail cement will be: 
 

135 sx.        HES HalCem (Type V) + 2% CaCl2 (Accelerator), mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 cfps, 5.05 gps  
                    fresh water 

Top Out:  As necessary with: 
 

                  HES HalCem (Type V) + 2% CaCl2 (Accelerator), mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 cfps, 5.05 gps  
                    fresh water 

 

Note:  The above number of sacks are calculated based on gauge hole.  Final field cement volumes will 

be based on gauge hole plus 70% excess on the lead slurry and gauge hole plus 100% 
excess on the tail slurry. 

 

Production Hole (2200’± - TD) 
 

Lead:  Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement from 400’ above top of Wasatch Formation to 200’± above 

9 5/8” surface casing shoe.  For improved mud displacement, lead slurry weight will be a minimum of 0.5 ppg over 
mud weight utilized at well TD and vary from 11.0 – 13.0 ppg. 
 

If lead slurry weight required is 11.0 ppg – 12.5 ppg, cement will be: 
 

HES Highbond 75 (75/25 Poz/G) + 6% Bentonite (Extender) + 0.3% Versaset (Thixotropic Additive) 
+ 2% Microbond (Expansion Additive)  

 

Calculated sacks with corresponding mixed slurry weights, yields and water requirements for 
above cement will be as follows: 

 

 210 sx. if 11.0 ppg, 2.52 cfps, 14.96 gps fresh water 
 

 245 sx. if 11.5 ppg, 2.12 cfps, 11.98 gps fresh water 
 

 285 sx. if 12.0 ppg, 1.83 cfps, 9.82 gps fresh water 
 

 325 sx. if 12.5 ppg, 1.61 cfps, 8.17 gps fresh water 
 

If lead slurry weight required is 13.0 ppg, cement will be: 
 

320 sx.        HES ExtendaCem (50/50 Poz/G) + 0.125 pps Pol-E-Flake (Lost Circulation Additive),   
                    mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.63 cfps, 8.16 gps fresh water 
  

Tail:  Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement from TD to 400’ above top of Wasatch Formation.  Tail 

cement will be: 
 

810 sx.        HES ExtendaCem (50/50 Poz/G) + 0.125 pps Pol-E-Flake (Lost Circulation Additive),   
                                 mixed at 13.5 ppg, 1.47 cfps, 6.98 gps fresh water 
 

Note:  The above number of sacks in all cases are calculated based on gauge hole.  Final field cement 
volumes will be based on gauge hole plus 50% excess on the lead slurry and gauge hole 
plus 70% excess on the tail slurry. 

Dec. 08, 2011

Sundry Number: 21109 API Well Number: 43047517310000

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:
Surface Hole (Surface - 2200'±):

Lead: Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement from 500' above casing shoe to surface. Lead
cement will be:

130 sx. HES VariCem (Type III)+ 2% Cal-Seal (Thixotropic Additive) + 0.3% Versaset
(Thixotropic Additive) + 2% Econolite (Light Weight Additive), mixed at 10.5 ppg,
4.10 cfps, 26.88 gps fresh water

Tail: Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement 500' above casing shoe. Tail cement will be:

135 sx. HES HalCem (Type V) + 2% CaCl2 (Accelerator), mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 cfps, 5.05 gps
fresh water

Top Out: As necessary with:

HES HalCem (Type V) + 2% CaCl2 (Accelerator), mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 cfps, 5.05 gps
fresh water

Note: The above number of sacks are calculated based on gauge hole. Final field cement volumes will
be based on gauge hole plus 70% excess on the lead slurry and gauge hole plus 100%
excess on the tail slurry.

Production Hole (2200'± - TD)

Lead: Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement from 400' above top of Wasatch Formation to 200'± above
9 5/8" surface casing shoe. For improved mud displacement, lead slurry weight will be a minimum of 0.5 ppg over
mud weight utilized at well TD and vary from 11.0 - 13.0 ppg.
If lead slurry weight required is 11.0 ppg - 12.5 ppg, cement will be:

HES Highbond 75 (75/25 Poz/G) + 6% Bentonite (Extender) + 0.3% Versaset (Thixotropic Additive)
+ 2% Microbond (Expansion Additive)

Calculated sacks with corresponding mixed slurry weights, yields and water requirements for
above cement will be as follows:

• 210 sx. if 11.0 ppg, 2.52 cfps, 14.96 gps fresh water
• 245 sx. if 11.5 ppg, 2.12 cfps, 11.98 gps fresh water
• 285 sx. if 12.0 ppg, 1.83 cfps, 9.82 gps fresh water
• 325 sx. if 12.5 ppg, 1.61 cfps, 8.17 gps fresh water

If lead slurry weight required is 13.0 ppg, cement will be:

320 sx. HES ExtendaCem (50/50 Poz/G) + 0.125 pps Pol-E-Flake (Lost Circulation Additive),
mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.63 cfps, 8.16 gps fresh water

Tail: Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement from TD to 400' above top of Wasatch Formation. Tail
cement will be:

810 sx. HES ExtendaCem (50/50 Poz/G) + 0.125 pps Pol-E-Flake (Lost Circulation Additive),
mixed at 13.5 ppg, 1.47 cfps, 6.98 gps fresh water

Note: The above number of sacks in all cases are calculated based on gauge hole. Final field cement
volumes will be based on gauge hole plus 50% excess on the lead slurry and gauge hole
plus 70% excess on the tail



Fonn3160-3 Revi'he'd BH 8/1/2011 FORM APPROVED
(August2007) OMBNo.1004-0137

ExpiresJtily31,2010
UNÏTED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE JNTERIOR 5. LeaseSerialNo.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTUO285A

APPLJCATION FOR PERMIT.,ËD ÎlÂ 6. IfIndian,AlloteeorTribeName

la. Typeof work: DRILL REEÑTER
If UnitorCAAgreement,NameandNo.

CHAPlTA WELLS UNIT
8. Lease NameandWellNo.

lb. Typeof Well: GilWell GasWell Other SingleZone MultipleZone CHAPITA WELLS IJNIT 1544 26D
2. Nameof 0perator EOG Resources, Inc. API WellNo.

3a. Address 1060 I¯ast Highway 40, Vernal UT 84078 3b. PhoneNo.(include area code) 10. FieldandPool,orExploratory
435-781-9111 NATURAL BUÌTES

4. Locationof Well (Report location clearly andin acconiancewith my Staterquirements.*) 11.Sec. T. R.M. or Blk.andSurveyorArea

Atsurface (NENE) 447 FNL, 501 FEL, 40.013011 Lat, 109.399542Lon SEC 26, 79S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

At proposedprod.zone (NENE) 1240 FNL, 624 FEL, 40.010868 Lat,109.99290 Lon

14. Distanceinmilesanddirectionfromnearesttown orpost office* 12. Countyor Parish 13. State
50.8 MILES FROM VERNAL UINTAH UT

15. Distancefromproposed*
624 16. No.of acresin lease 17. SpacingUnitdedicatedto thiswell

locationtonearest 1800
propertyor leaseline, ft.
(Alsotonearest drig.unit line,if any)

18. Distancefromproposedlocation*
620 19. ProposedDepth 20. BLM/BIABondNo.onfile

tonearestwell, drilling,completed, 9310 TVD, 9415 MD NM2308applied for,on thislease,ft.

21. Elevations(Showwhether DF,KDB,RT, GL,etc.) 22. Approximatedatework will start* 23. Estimatedduration
5015 NAT GL 45 DÄYS

24. Attachments

Thefollowing,completedin accordancewith the requirements of OnshoreOiland GasOrderNo.1,mustbe attachedto thisform:

1. Wellplatcertifiedby a registeredsurveyor. 4. Bondtocoverthe operationsunlesscoveredby an existing bondon file (see
1 A DrillingPlan. Item20above).

3. A SurfaceUse Plan (if the location is on National Forest SystemLands, the 5. Operatorcertification
SUPO must be theappropriate ForestServiceOffice). 6. SuLeothersite specificinformationand/orplansas maybe requiredbythe

25. Naine (Printed/Typed) Date
kayleneR. Gardner 06/16/2011

. Regulato Specialist

Approvedby Name (Printediëfry Kenczka DEC11 2011
Title 8 N Manager Office

nds MinerafResources VERNALFIELDOFFICE
Applicationapprovaldoesnot warrantor certifythattheapplicantholdslegalorequitabletitletothoserights inthesubjectleasewhichwouldentitletheapplicantto
conductoperationsthereon.
Conditionsof approval,ifany,are attached.

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001andTitle43 U.S.C.Section1212,makeit a crimefor anypersonknowinglyand willfully tomaketoany departmentor agencyof theUnited
Statesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulent statementsor representationsas to anymatterwithin itsjurisdiction.

(Continued on page 2) *(Instructions on page 2)

RECENED
NOTICEOFAPPROVAL

Og OF0\L,GAS



UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: EOG Resources, Inc. Location: NENE, Sec. 26, T9S, R22E
Well No: CWU1544-26D Lease No: UTU-0285A
API No: 43-047-51731 Agreement:

OFFICE NUMBER: (435) 781-4400

OFFICE FAX NUMBER: (435) 781-3420

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with the applicable
laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill including Surface and
Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors.
A copy of the approved APD must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion operations. This
permit is approved for a two (2) year period, or until lease expiration, whichever occurs first. An additional
extension, up to two (2) years, may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and
(Notify Environmental Scientist) access roads.

Location Completion - Prior to moving on the drilling rig.
(Notify Environmental Scientist)

Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notify Petroleum Engineer)

Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.) cementing all casing strings to:

blm ut vn opreport@blm.gov

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.)

First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify Petroleum Engineer) production resumes after well has been off production for I

more than ninety (90)
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SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

• All new and replacement internal combustion gas field engines of less than or equal to 300 design-
rated horsepower must not emit more than 2 gms of NOx per horsepower-hour. This requirement
does not apply to gas field engines of less than or equal to 40 design-rated horsepower.

• All and replacement internal combustion gas field engines of greater than 300 design rated
horsepower must not emit more than 1.0 gms of NOx per horsepower-hour.

• Ifthere is an active Gilsonite mining operation within 2 miles of the well location, operator shall
notify the Gilsonite operator at least 48 hours prior to any blasting during construction.

• If paleontological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop
work and contact the Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will be made by the AO as to what
mitigation may be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material before construction can
continue.

• Surface pipelines will be placed 5-10 feet outside of the borrow area.

• Monitor the initial ground disturbing construction of the well pad by a qualified permitted
paleontologist and thereafterspot-monitor the location during the remainder of the construction
process. Report all mitigation-curation of vertebrates and other scientifically significant fossils that
may be affected by the
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DOWNHOLE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE COAs:

• Cement for the surface casing shall be circulated to surface and/or topped off.

• Gamma ray Log shall be run from Total Depth to Surface.

• Cement for the production casing must be brought to at least 200' above the surface casing shoe.

• Variances Granted: Air Drilling

• Properly lubricated and maintained rotating head. Variance granted to use a properly maintained
and lubricated diverter bowl in place of a rotating head.

• Blooie line discharge 100' from the well bore. Variances granted for blooie line discharge to be 75'
from the well bore and may not be straight.

• Compressors located in the opposite direction from the blooie line a minimum of 100' from the well
bore. Variance granted for rig mounted air compressors located within 40' of the well.

• In lieu of mud products on location, operator will have sufficient water on location for the mud kill
medium during air drilling operations.

• Automatic igniter. Variance granted for igniter, a diffuser will be used instead. Operator will mount a
deflector at the end of the blooie line to change direction and reduce the velocity of the cuttings flow
to the reserve pit.

• De-dusting Equipment. Variance granted, dust controlled by water mist during air drilling
operations.

AII provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly adhered
to. The following items are emphasized:

DRILLING|COMPLETIONIPRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

• The spud date and timeshall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of spudding.

• Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least 24 hours in
advance of casinq cementinq operations and BOPE & casinq pressure tests.

• AIIrequirements listed in Onshore Order #2 lll. E. Special Drilling Operations are applicable for air
drilling of surface
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• Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use until the well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times.
Choke manifolds shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

• All BOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the daily
drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order
No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be performed by a
test pump with a chart recorder and i by the rig pumps. Test shall be reported in the driller's
log.

• BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from under
the surface casing and weekly thereafteras specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

• Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and
cemented in place.

• No aggressivelfresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used withincasing.

• Cement baskets shall not be run on surface casing.

• The operator must report all shows of water or water-bearing sands to the BLM. Ifflowing water is
encountered it must be sampled, analyzed, and a copy of the analyses submitted to the BLMVernal
Field Office.

• The operator must report encounters of all non oil & gas mineral resources (such as Gilsonite, tar
sands, oil shale, trona, etc.) to the Vernal Field Office, in writing, within 5 working days of each
encounter. Each report shall include the well namelnumber, well location, date and depth (from KB
or GL) of encounter, vertical footage of the encounter and, the name of the person making the
report (along with a telephone number) should the BLM need to obtain additional information.

• A complete set of angular deviation and directional surveys of a directional well will be submitted to
the Vernal BLM office engineer within 30 days of the completion of the well.

• While actively drilling, chronologic drilling progress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM,
Vernal Field Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers
until the well is completed.

• A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the top of cement and shall
be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of the CBL
to this office.

• Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
BLM_UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

• There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Any changes in operation must
have prior approval from the BLMVernal Field
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OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

• All wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator, lease serial
number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

• For information regarding production reporting, contact the Office of Natural Resources Revenue
(ONRR) at www.ONRR.qov.

• Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLMVernal Field office must be
notifiedwhen it is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be by written communication
and must be received in this office by not later than the fifth business day following the date on
which the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a minimum,the following
informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephone number.

o Well name and number.

o Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royalty will be
paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise the
non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will be
reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A, shall be reported
verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than Major Events" will
be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on the Monthly Report of
Operations and Production.

• Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and Recompletion
Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days after completion of
the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1.
Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled
during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be filed on BLM Form 3160-4.
Submit with the well completion report a geologic report including, at a minimum, formation tops,
and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys, sample descriptions, strip logs,
core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if performed. Samples (cuttings,
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and/or gas) shall be submitted onlywhen requested by the BLM,Vernal Field Office.

• All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or comminglingon-lease or off-lease, shall have prior
written approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The BLMVernal Field Office
Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and timefor the initial meter calibration and all
future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be submitted to the
BLMVernal Field Office. All measurement facilities willconform to the API standards for liquid
hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement. All measurement points shall
be identified as the point of sale or allocation for royalty purposes.

• A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted to
the BLMVernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs first.
All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be adhered to. All
product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively sealed in
accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3.

• Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filing of a
suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLMVernal Field Office. Emergency approval may be
obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

• No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover .

equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior approval
of the BLMVernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30 days, prior
approval of the BLMVernal Field Office shall be obtained and notificationgiven before resumption
of operations.

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water produced
from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent disposal
method must be approved by this officeand in operation prior to the end of this 90-day period. In
order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal method shall be
submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but no later than 45 days
after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not been approved prior to the
end of the authorized 90-day period willbe considered as an Incident of Noncompliance and willbe
grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for disposing of said water is
provided and approved by this office.

• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or abandoned,
all pits must be fenced immediately untilthey are backfilled. The "Subsequent Report of
Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual plugging of
the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of casing left in
hole, and the current status of the surface



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1544-26D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

12/18/2011

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The referenced well was spud on 12/18/2011.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Nanette Lupcho 435 781-9157

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/19/2011

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEUAOS2E8D5ESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITA WELLS

1.TYPEOFYVELL 8.VVELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1544-26D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources,Inc. 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0447 FNL 0501 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.05 Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

O NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:

12/18/2011 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was spud on 12/18/2011.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Nanette Lupcho 435 781-9157 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1544-26D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

12/18/2011

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 No activity has occurred since spud on 12/18/2011.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Nanette Lupcho 435 781-9157

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/19/2011

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEUAOS2E8D5ESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITA WELLS

1.TYPEOFYVELL 8.VVELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1544-26D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources,Inc. 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0447 FNL 0501 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.05 Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

O NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

12/18/2011
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

No activity has occurred since spud on 12/18/2011.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Nanette Lupcho 435 781-9157 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



STATEOF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator. EOG Resources, Inc· Operator Account Number N 9550

Address: 1060 East Highway40

city Vemal

aggy UT zip 84078 Phone Number. (435) 781-9157

Well 1
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-51731 CHAPITAWELLS UNIT1544-26D NENE 26 9S 22E UINTÀH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EffectiveDate

99999 12/tB/2011
Comments: MESAVERDE

w
Number WeK Nmne QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity NewEntity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

I Number WeifName O Sec Twp Rngi County

ActionCode Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish new entity for newwell (singlewe11only) Nanette Lupcho

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) t)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entityto anotherexisting entity
D - Re·assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Si stusi /
E - Other (Explain in 'comments'section) RECEIVED Regula AssWtant 12/19/2011

TRio Dale

DEC2 0 2011

DIV.0F01L,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1544-26D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

1/3/2012

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 No activity has occurred since spud on 12/18/2011 to 01/03/2012.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Nanette Lupcho 435 781-9157

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 1/3/2012

01/03/2012

Jan. 03, 2012

Sundry Number: 21681 API Well Number: 43047517310000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING g-i-EA02E DEASIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITA WELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1544-26D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 E×t NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0447 FNL 0501 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.05 Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

1/3/2012
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

No activity has occurred since spud on 12/18/2011 to 01/03/2012.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR REGORB(MILY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Nanette Lupcho 435 781-9157 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1544-26D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

12/18/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests authorization for the disposal of
produced water at the following locations: NBU 20-20B SWD, CWU 550-30N

SWD & CWU 2-29 SWD ROW# UTU85038, Red Wash Evaporation Ponds
1,2,3,4,5,6&7, White River Evaporation Ponds 1&2, Coyote Evaporation Ponds
1&2, Coyote 1-16 SWD and Hoss SWD Wells ROW# UTU86010 & UTU897093.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Nanette Lupcho 435 781-9157

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/19/2011

12/29/2011

Dec. 19, 2011

Sundry Number: 21398 API Well Number: 43047517310000Federal Approval of this
Action is Necessary

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING gyEA02E DEASIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITA WELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1544-26D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 E×t NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0447 FNL 0501 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.05 Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

12/18/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests authorization for the disposal of
produced water at the following locations: NBU 20-20B SWD, CWU 550-30N

SWD & CWU 2-29 SWD ROW# UTU85038, Red Wash Evaporation Ponds Accepted by the
1,2,3,4,5,6&7, White River Evaporation Ponds 1&2, Coyote Evaporation Pongah Division of
1&2, Coyote 1-16 SWD and Hoss SWD Wells ROW# UTU86010 & UTU89700, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD(GINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Nanette Lupcho 435 781-9157 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company; EOG RESOURCES INC

Well Name: CWU 1544-26D

Api No: 43-047-51731 Lease Type FEDERAL

Section 26 Township 09S Range 22E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor CRAIG'S ROUSTABOUT SERV RIG # 6

SPUDDED:
Date 01/18/2012

Time 3:00 PM

How ROTARY

Drilling wi/I
Commence:

Reported by KYLON COOK

Telephone # (435) 828-4682

Date 01/18 /2012 Signed



RECEIVED: Feb. 02, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1544-26D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

2 /2 /2012

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The referenced well reached TD on 01/17/2012, please see the
attached well chronology report for the referenced well showing all

activity up to 02/02/2012.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Nanette Lupcho 435 781-9157

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2 /2 /2012

February 02, 2012

Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1544-26D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0447 FNL 0501 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

2/2/2012
WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well reached TD on 01/17/2012, please see the Accepted by the
attached well chronology report for the referenced well showing all Utah Division of

activity up to 02/02/2012. Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
February 02, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Nanette Lupcho 435 781-9157 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/2/2012

RECEIVED: Feb. 02,



RECEIVED: Feb. 02, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE.

12−23−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $38,700 Completion $0 Well Total $38,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL.

12−26−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $38,700 Completion $0 Well Total $38,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 90% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL

12−27−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $38,700 Completion $0 Well Total $38,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 WAITING ON AIR RIG, HAULING MATERIAL FOR CLOSED LOOP.

12−28−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $38,700 Completion $0 Well Total $38,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 100%. FINISH UP CLOSED LOOP TODAY.

01−14−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $17,455 Completion $0 Daily Total $17,455

Cum Costs: Drilling $56,155 Completion $0 Well Total $56,155

MD 386 TVD 386 Progress 67 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 386’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

Page 3

Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE.

12-23-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $38,700 Completion $0 Well Total $38,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL.

12-26-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $38,700 Completion $0 Well Total $38,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 90% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL

12-27-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $38,700 Completion $0 Well Total $38,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 WAITING ON AIR RIG, HAULING MATERIAL FOR CLOSED LOOP.

12-28-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $38,700 Completion $0 Well Total $38,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 100%. FINISH UP CLOSED LOOP TODAY

01-14-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $17,455 Completion $0 Daily Total $17,455

Cum Costs: Drilling $56,155 Completion $0 Well Total $56,155

MD 386 TVD 386 Progress 67 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @386'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

Page 3

RECEIVED: Feb. 02,



RECEIVED: Feb. 02, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

16:00 23:00 7.0 0 0 MURI ON CWU 1544−26D.

23:00 23:30 0.5 0 0 RIG ON DAY WORK @ 23:00 PM ON 01/13/2012.


TALLY BHA.


WELL PREDRILLED FROM 79’ TO 319’ KOP.


THIS WELL PLANNED AZIMUTH 188.62*, INC 19.00*.


MUD MOTOR 1.75 DEGREE BEND, RPG .16, BIT TO BEND 7.08’, BIT TO MWD 59’.

23:30 04:00 4.5 0 0 PICK UP BHA AND ORIENT MWD. TRIP IN HOLE TO 319’ KOP.

04:00 06:00 2.0 319 386 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 319’ TO 386’. 67’. ROP 33.5’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 8K, WOB SLIDE 8K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 600, DIFF PSI 100.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: RIGGING UP.


FUEL USED 300 GALLONS.

01−15−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,756 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,756

Cum Costs: Drilling $83,911 Completion $0 Well Total $83,911

MD 1,196 TVD 1,187 Progress 810 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 1196’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 386 836 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 386’ TO 836’. 450’. ROP 37.5’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 900, DIFF PSI 50. 2’ LOW AND 5’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 17% SLIDE 83%. TFO 20L.

18:00 06:00 12.0 836 1196 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 836’ TO 1196’. 360’. ROP 30’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 10K, WOB SLIDE 12K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9’ HIGH AND 9’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 38% SLIDE 62%. TFO 30L.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: MAKING CONNECTIONS AND PUMP SAFETY.


FUEL USED 1000 GALLONS.

01−16−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $26,889 Completion $0 Daily Total $26,889

Cum Costs: Drilling $110,800 Completion $0 Well Total $110,800

MD 1,676 TVD 1,651 Progress 480 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 1676’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 1196 1476 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1196’ TO 1476’. 280’. ROP 23’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9’ HIGH AND 7’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 80% SLIDE 20%. TFO 10R.

18:00 06:00 12.0 1476 1676 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1476’ TO 1676’. 200’. ROP 16.6’ FPH.


Page 4

Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

16:00 23:00 7.0 0 0 MURI ON CWU 1544-26D.

23:00 23:30 0.5 0 0 RIG ON DAY WORK @23:00 PM ON 01/13/2012.1

TALLY BHA.I

WELL PREDRILLED FROM 79' TO 319' KOP.1

THIS WELL PLANNED AZIMUTH 188.62*, INC 19.00*.1

MUD MOTOR 1.75 DEGREE BEND, RPG .16, BIT TO BEND 7.08', BIT TO MWD 59'.

23:30 04:00 4.5 0 0 PICK UP BHA AND ORIENT MWD. TRIP IN HOLE TO 319' KOP.

04:00 06:00 2.0 319 386 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 319' TO 386'. 67'. ROP 33.5'FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 8K, WOB SLIDE 8K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 600, DIFF PSI 100.1

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: RIGGING UP.1

FUEL USED 300 GALLONS.

01-15-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,756 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,756

Cum Costs: Drilling $83,911 Completion $0 Well Total $83,911

MD 1,196 TVD 1,187 Progress 810 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @1196'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 386 836 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 386' TO 836'. 450'. ROP 37.5'FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 900, DIFF PSI 50. 2' LOW AND 5' RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 17% SLIDE 83%. TFO 20L.

18:00 06:00 12.0 836 1196 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 836' TO 1196'. 360'. ROP 30' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 10K, WOB SLIDE 12K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9' HIGH AND 9'RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 38% SLIDE 62%. TFO 30L.I

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: MAKING CONNECTIONS AND PUMP SAFETY.1

FUEL USED 1000 GALLONS.

01-16-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $26,889 Completion $0 Daily Total $26,889

Cum Costs: Drilling $110,800 Completion $0 Well Total $110,800

MD 1,676 TVD 1,651 Progress 480 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @1676'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 1196 1476 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1196' TO 1476'. 280'. ROP 23' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9' HIGH AND 7'RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 80% SLIDE 20%. TFO 10R.

18:00 06:00 12.0 1476 1676 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1476' TO 1676'. 200'. ROP 16.6' FPH.1
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RECEIVED: Feb. 02,



RECEIVED: Feb. 02, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

WOB ROTATE 11K, WOB SLIDE 14K. ROTARY RPM 45, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 4’ LOW AND 5’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 70% SLIDE 30%. TFO 0G.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: PPE AND SKID STEER SAFETY.


FUEL USED 1350 GALLONS.

01−17−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,728 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,728

Cum Costs: Drilling $138,528 Completion $0 Well Total $138,528

MD 2,066 TVD 2,033 Progress 390 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 2066’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 20:00 14.0 1676 2006 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1676’ TO 2006’. 330’. ROP 23.5’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18−20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26’ LOW AND 2’ LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.

20:00 23:30 3.5 0 0 WORK ON PUMP. START CLEANING MUD TANKS WHILE SHUT DOWN WORKING ON PUMP.

23:30 00:30 1.0 0 0 FINISH CLEANING MUD TANKS.

00:30 03:30 3.0 0 0 WORK STUCK PIPE AND CIRCULATE.


TRIPPED OFF BOTTOM 150’ BEFORE WORKING ON PUMP. ALSO MOVED PIPE EVERY 5−10 MIN
WHILE WORKING ON PUMP AND CLEANING TANKS. STARTED PUMPING TO TRIP BACK TO
BOTTOM, HAD FULL CIRCULATION BUT COULD NOT MOVE PIPE UP, DOWN, OR ROTATE.

03:30 06:00 2.5 2006 2066 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2006’ TO 2066’. 60’. ROP 24’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18−20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26’ LOW AND 2’ LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: SLIPS, TRIPS, & FALLS AND HIGH PRESSURE LINES.


FUEL USED 1100 GALLONS.

01−18−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,831 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,831

Cum Costs: Drilling $174,359 Completion $0 Well Total $174,359

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 207 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 2066 2096 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2066’ TO 2096’. (TRYING TO SLIDE).

09:30 12:00 2.5 2096 2096 CHANGE OUT UNION AT TOP OF POWER HEAD. (UNION WAS WASHED OUT).

12:00 17:00 5.0 2096 2273 DRILL ROTATE FROM 2096’ TO 2273’. 177’. ROP 35’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM 517. PSI 1200,
DIFF PSI 100. 59’ LOW AND 37’ LEFT OF LINE. TD @ 17:00 PM ON 01/17/2012.

17:00 18:30 1.5 2273 2273 CIRCULATE FOR WIPER TRIP.

18:30 21:30 3.0 2273 2273 TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS. A FEW TIGHT SPOTS FROM 1466’ OUT TO 986’.
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Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

WOB ROTATE llK, WOB SLIDE 14K. ROTARY RPM 45, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 4' LOW AND 5'RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 70% SLIDE 30%. TFO OG.1

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: PPE AND SKID STEER SAFETY.1

FUEL USED 1350 GALLONS.

01-17-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,728 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,728

Cum Costs: Drilling $138,528 Completion $0 Well Total $138,528

MD 2,066 TVD 2,033 Progress 390 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @2066'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 20:00 14.0 1676 2006 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1676' TO 2006'. 330'. ROP 23.5' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18-20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26' LOW AND 2' LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.

20:00 23:30 3.5 0 0 WORK ON PUMP. START CLEANING MUD TANKS WHILE SHUT DOWN WORKING ON PUMP.

23:30 00:30 1.0 0 0 FINISH CLEANING MUD TANKS.

00:30 03:30 3.0 0 0 WORK STUCK PIPE AND CIRCULATE.1

TRIPPED OFF BOTTOM 150' BEFORE WORKING ON PUMP. ALSO MOVED PIPE EVERY 5-10 MIN
WHILE WORKING ON PUMP AND CLEANING TANKS. STARTED PUMPING TO TRIP BACK TO
BOTTOM, HAD FULL CIRCULATION BUT COULD NOT MOVE PIPE UP, DOWN, OR ROTATE.

03:30 06:00 2.5 2006 2066 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2006' TO 2066'. 60'. ROP 24' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18-20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26' LOW AND 2' LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: SLIPS, TRIPS, & FALLS AND HIGH PRESSURE LINES.I

FUEL USED 1100 GALLONS.

01-18-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,831 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,831

Cum Costs: Drilling $174,359 Completion $0 Well Total $174,359

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 207 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 2066 2096 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2066' TO 2096'. (TRYING TO SLIDE).

09:30 12:00 2.5 2096 2096 CHANGE OUT UNION AT TOP OF POWER HEAD. (UNION WAS WASHED OUT).

12:00 17:00 5.0 2096 2273 DRILL ROTATE FROM 2096' TO 2273'. 177'. ROP 35'FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM 517. PSI 1200,
DIFF PSI 100. 59' LOW AND 37' LEFT OF LINE. TD @17:00 PM ON 01/17/2012.

17:00 18:30 1.5 2273 2273 CIRCULATE FOR WIPER TRIP.

18:30 21:30 3.0 2273 2273 TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS. A FEW TIGHT SPOTS FROM 1466' OUT TO 986'.
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RECEIVED: Feb. 02,



RECEIVED: Feb. 02, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

21:30 22:30 1.0 2273 2273 WORK ON WINCH LINE ON RIG.

22:30 01:00 2.5 2273 2273 FINISH TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

01:00 05:00 4.0 2273 2273 TALLY BHA WITH TRI−CONE AND REAMER. TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM.

05:00 06:00 1.0 2273 2273 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: TRIPPING PIPE AND WINCH LINE SAFTEY.


FUEL USED 850 GALLONS.

01−19−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $103,203 Completion $0 Daily Total $103,203

Cum Costs: Drilling $277,562 Completion $0 Well Total $277,562

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 0 0 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.

07:00 11:30 4.5 0 0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

11:30 13:30 2.0 0 0 RIG UP TO RUN CASING.

13:30 18:00 4.5 0 0 RUN 54 JTS (2244.69’) OF 9−5/8", 36.0#, K−55, ST&C CASING WITH HALLIBURTON GUIDE SHOE
AND FLOAT COLLAR. 12 CENTRALIZERS SPACED 10’ FROM THE SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2
AND #3 THEN EVERY 5TH COLLAR TO SURFACE. ALSO 2 CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @
2223.69’ TVD / 2263.69’ MD.

18:00 19:00 1.0 0 0 RUN 200’ OF 1" PIPE.

19:00 20:00 1.0 0 0 RDMO CRAIG’S PRESET RIG. RELEASE RIG @ 20:00 PM ON 01/18/12. MOVING TO CWU 1543−26D.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETINGS: TRIPPING PIPE AND RUNNING CASING.


FUEL USED 150 GALLONS.

20:00 06:00 10.0 0 0 CEMENT JOB: MIRU HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED
LINES AND CEMENT VALVE TO 4000 PSIG. PUMPED 30 BBLS FRESH WATER & 20 BBLS GELLED
WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT.





LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (183 BBLS) OF PREMIUM LEAD CEMENT WITH 0.3%
VERSASET, 2% CAL−SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @ 10.5 PPG WITH YIELD
OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT WITH 2%
CACL2 MIXED TAIL CEMENT @ 15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.2 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH
170 BBLS DIRTY WATER. BUMPED PLUG WITH 1000# @ 23:49 PM ON 01/18/12. FLOAT HELD.
SHUT−IN CASING VALVE. BROKE CIRCULATION 130 BBLS INTO LEAD CEMENT, LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE 70 BBLS INTO DISPLACEMENT. CIRCULATED ABOUT 100 BBLS OF LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE. WOC 1 HR 30 MIN.





TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 200’ OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL.





PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER
ACTIVITY.
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Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

21:30 22:30 1.0 2273 2273 WORK ON WINCH LINE ON RIG.

22:30 01:00 2.5 2273 2273 FINISH TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

01:00 05:00 4.0 2273 2273 TALLY BHA WITH TRI-CONE AND REAMER. TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM.

05:00 06:00 1.0 2273 2273 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.1

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: TRIPPING PIPE AND WINCH LINE SAFTEY.1

FUEL USED 850 GALLONS.

01-19-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $103,203 Completion $0 Daily Total $103,203

Cum Costs: Drilling $277,562 Completion $0 Well Total $277,562

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 0 0 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.

07:00 11:30 4.5 0 0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

11:30 13:30 2.0 0 0 RIG UP TO RUN CASING.

13:30 18:00 4.5 0 0 RUN 54 JTS (2244.69') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#, K-55, ST&C CASING WITH HALLIBURTON GUIDE SHOE
AND FLOAT COLLAR. 12 CENTRALIZERS SPACED 10'FROM THE SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2
AND #3 THEN EVERY 5TH COLLAR TO SURFACE. ALSO 2 CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @
2223.69' TVD / 2263.69' MD.

18:00 19:00 1.0 0 0 RUN 200' OF 1" PIPE.

19:00 20:00 1.0 0 0 RDMO CRAIG'S PRESET RIG. RELEASE RIG @20:00 PM ON 01/18/12. MOVING TO CWU 1543-26D.

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETINGS: TRIPPING PIPE AND RUNNING CASING.1

FUEL USED 150 GALLONS.

20:00 06:00 10.0 0 0 CEMENT JOB: MIRU HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED
LINES AND CEMENT VALVE TO 4000 PSIG. PUMPED 30 BBLS FRESH WATER & 20 BBLS GELLED
WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT.1

LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (183 BBLS) OF PREMIUM LEAD CEMENT WITH 0.3%
VERSASET, 2% CAL-SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @10.5 PPG WITH YIELD
OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT WITH 2%
CACL2 MIXED TAIL CEMENT @15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.2 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH
170 BBLS DIRTY WATER. BUMPED PLUG WITH 1000# @23:49 PM ON 01/18/12. FLOAT HELD.
SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. BROKE CIRCULATION 130 BBLS INTO LEAD CEMENT, LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE 70 BBLS INTO DISPLACEMENT. CIRCULATED ABOUT 100 BBLS OF LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE. WOC 1 HR 30 MIN.1

TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 200' OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL.I

PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER
ACTIVITY.1
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RECEIVED: Feb. 02, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346




KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED BLM VIA E−MAIL OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON
01/17/12 @ 14:45 PM. KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELS WITH UDOGM VIA PHONE OF
THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 01/17/12 @ 14:45 PM.

Page 7

Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 22685 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED BLM VIA E-MAIL OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON
01/17/12 @14:45 PM. KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELS WITH UDOGM VIA PHONE OF
THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 01/17/12 @14:45 PM.
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RECEIVED: Feb. 02,



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1544-26D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

3 /7 /2012

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The referenced well shares a pad with Chapita Wells Unit 1541-26D,
1542-26D, 1543-26D and 1546-26D. Surface casing on the referenced
well has been set. Please see the attached well chronology report for the

referenced well showing all activity up to 3/7/2012.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3 /7 /2012

March 07, 2012

Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1544-26D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0447 FNL 0501 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

3/7/2012
WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well shares a pad with Chapita Wells Unit 1541-26D ' Accepted by the
1542-26D, 1543-26D and 1546-26D. Surface casing on the referenced Utah Division of
well has been set. Please see the attached well chronology report for the Oil, Gas and Mining

referenced well showing all activity up to 3/7/2012. FOR RECORD ONLY
March 07, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/7/2012

RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 03−06−2012

Well Name CWU 1544−26D Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43−047−51731 Well Class DRIL

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9,310/ 9,415 Property # 066346

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 9.625 Shoe TVD / MD 2,223/ 2,263

KB / GL Elev 5,034/ 5,015

Location Section 26−T9S−R22E, NENE, 447 FNL & 501 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.139316

AFE No 310498 AFE Total 1,598,100 DHC / CWC 751,800/ 846,300

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #34 Start Date 12−01−2011 Release Date

12−01−2011 Reported By SHARON CAUDILL

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION DATA


447’ FNL & 501’ FEL (NE/NE)


SECTION 26, T9S, R22E


UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH





LAT 40 DEG 00’ 46.84", LONG 109 DEG 23’ 58.35"  (NAD 83)


LAT 40 DEG 00’ 46.96", LONG 109 DEG 23’ 55.90"  (NAD 27)





BHL: 1240’ FNL & 501’ FEL (NENE)


SECTION 26, T9S, R22E


UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH





TRUE #34


OBJECTIVE: 9415’ MD, 9310’ TVD, MESAVERDE


DW/GAS


CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECT


DD&A:  CHAPITA DEEP


NATURAL BUTTES FIELD





LEASE: FEDERAL UTU0285A


Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 03-06-2012

Well Name CWU 1544-26D Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43-047-51731 Well Class DRIL

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9,310/ 9,415 Property # 066346

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 9.625 Shoe TVD / MD 2,223/ 2,263

KB / GL Elev 5,034/ 5,015

Location Section 26-T9S-R22E, NENE, 447 FNL & 501 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.139316

AFE No 310498 AFE Total 1,598,100 DHC / CWC 751,800/ 846,300

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #34 Start Date 12-01-2011 Release Date

12-01-2011 Reported By SHARON CAUDILL

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION DATA I

447' FNL & 501' FEL (NE/NE) I

SECTION 26, T9S, R22El

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAHL

LAT 40 DEG 00'46.84", LONG 109 DEG 23' 58.35" (NAD 83)T

LAT 40 DEG 00'46.96", LONG 109 DEG 23' 55.90" (NAD 27)T

BHL: 1240'FNL & 501'FEL (NENE)T

SECTION 26, T9S, R22El

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAHL

TRUE #341

OBJECTIVE: 9415' MD, 9310' TVD, MESAVERDE T

DW/GAS T

CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECTI

DD&A: CHAPITADEEPT

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD E

LEASE: FEDERAL UTU0285Al

RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

ELEVATION: 5015.3’ NAT GL, 5015.3’ PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL IS 5015’), 5034’ KB
(19’)


MULTI PAD CWU 1541−26D, CWU 1542−26DX, CWU 1543−26D, CWU 1544−26D, CWU 1545−26D,
CWU 1546−26D





EOG WI 100%, NRI 82.139316%

12−19−2011 Reported By GERALD ASHCRAFT/ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Daily Total $53,700

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION/LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 60 CRAIG’S BUCKET RIG SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 12/18/11 @ 08:00 AM, SET 60’ OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX.





BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 12/16/11 @ 10:58 AM.

06:00 0 0 LOCATION BUILD STARTED 12/16/11. PUSHING ON LOCATION (55% COMPLETE).

12−20−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 75% COMPLETE.

12−21−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 80% COMPLETE.

12−22−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE.
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Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

ELEVATION: 5015.3' NAT GL, 5015.3' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL IS 5015'), 5034' KB
(19')

MULTI PAD CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26DX, CWU 1543-26D, CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D,
CWU 1546-26D

EOG WI 100%, NRI 82.139316%

12-19-2011 Reported By GERALD ASHCRAFT/ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Daily Total $53,700

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION/LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 60 CRAIG'S BUCKET RIG SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 12/18/11 @08:00 AM, SET 60' OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX.

BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 12/16/11 @10:58 AM.

06:00 0 0 LOCATION BUILD STARTED 12/16/11. PUSHING ON LOCATION (55% COMPLETE).

12-20-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 75% COMPLETE.

12-21-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 80% COMPLETE.

12-22-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE.
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RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

12−23−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL.

12−26−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 90% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL

12−27−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 WAITING ON AIR RIG, HAULING MATERIAL FOR CLOSED LOOP.

12−28−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 100%. FINISH UP CLOSED LOOP TODAY.

01−14−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $17,455 Completion $0 Daily Total $17,455

Cum Costs: Drilling $71,155 Completion $0 Well Total $71,155

MD 386 TVD 386 Progress 67 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 386’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

16:00 23:00 7.0 0 0 MURI ON CWU 1544−26D.
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Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

12-23-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL.

12-26-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 90% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL

12-27-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 WAITING ON AIR RIG, HAULING MATERIAL FOR CLOSED LOOP.

12-28-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 100%. FINISH UP CLOSED LOOP TODAY

01-14-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $17,455 Completion $0 Daily Total $17,455

Cum Costs: Drilling $71,155 Completion $0 Well Total $71,155

MD 386 TVD 386 Progress 67 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @386'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

16:00 23:00 7.0 0 0 MURI ON CWU 1544-26D.
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RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

23:00 23:30 0.5 0 0 RIG ON DAY WORK @ 23:00 PM ON 01/13/2012.


TALLY BHA.


WELL PREDRILLED FROM 79’ TO 319’ KOP.


THIS WELL PLANNED AZIMUTH 188.62*, INC 19.00*.


MUD MOTOR 1.75 DEGREE BEND, RPG .16, BIT TO BEND 7.08’, BIT TO MWD 59’.

23:30 04:00 4.5 0 0 PICK UP BHA AND ORIENT MWD. TRIP IN HOLE TO 319’ KOP.

04:00 06:00 2.0 319 386 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 319’ TO 386’. 67’. ROP 33.5’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 8K, WOB SLIDE 8K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 600, DIFF PSI 100.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: RIGGING UP.


FUEL USED 300 GALLONS.

01−15−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,756 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,756

Cum Costs: Drilling $98,911 Completion $0 Well Total $98,911

MD 1,196 TVD 1,187 Progress 810 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 1196’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 386 836 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 386’ TO 836’. 450’. ROP 37.5’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 900, DIFF PSI 50. 2’ LOW AND 5’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 17% SLIDE 83%. TFO 20L.

18:00 06:00 12.0 836 1196 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 836’ TO 1196’. 360’. ROP 30’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 10K, WOB SLIDE 12K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9’ HIGH AND 9’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 38% SLIDE 62%. TFO 30L.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: MAKING CONNECTIONS AND PUMP SAFETY.


FUEL USED 1000 GALLONS.

01−16−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $26,889 Completion $0 Daily Total $26,889

Cum Costs: Drilling $125,800 Completion $0 Well Total $125,800

MD 1,676 TVD 1,651 Progress 480 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 1676’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 1196 1476 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1196’ TO 1476’. 280’. ROP 23’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9’ HIGH AND 7’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 80% SLIDE 20%. TFO 10R.

18:00 06:00 12.0 1476 1676 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1476’ TO 1676’. 200’. ROP 16.6’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 11K, WOB SLIDE 14K. ROTARY RPM 45, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 4’ LOW AND 5’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 70% SLIDE 30%. TFO 0G.


Page 4

Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

23:00 23:30 0.5 0 0 RIG ON DAY WORK @23:00 PM ON 01/13/2012.1

TALLY BHA.I

WELL PREDRILLED FROM 79' TO 319' KOP.1

THIS WELL PLANNED AZIMUTH 188.62*, INC 19.00*.1

MUD MOTOR 1.75 DEGREE BEND, RPG .16, BIT TO BEND 7.08', BIT TO MWD 59'.

23:30 04:00 4.5 0 0 PICK UP BHA AND ORIENT MWD. TRIP IN HOLE TO 319' KOP.

04:00 06:00 2.0 319 386 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 319' TO 386'. 67'. ROP 33.5'FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 8K, WOB SLIDE 8K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 600, DIFF PSI 100.1

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: RIGGING UP.1

FUEL USED 300 GALLONS.

01-15-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,756 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,756

Cum Costs: Drilling $98,911 Completion $0 Well Total $98,911

MD 1,196 TVD 1,187 Progress 810 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @1196'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 386 836 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 386' TO 836'. 450'. ROP 37.5'FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 900, DIFF PSI 50. 2' LOW AND 5' RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 17% SLIDE 83%. TFO 20L.

18:00 06:00 12.0 836 1196 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 836' TO 1196'. 360'. ROP 30' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 10K, WOB SLIDE 12K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9' HIGH AND 9'RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 38% SLIDE 62%. TFO 30L.I

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: MAKING CONNECTIONS AND PUMP SAFETY.1

FUEL USED 1000 GALLONS.

01-16-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $26,889 Completion $0 Daily Total $26,889

Cum Costs: Drilling $125,800 Completion $0 Well Total $125,800

MD 1,676 TVD 1,651 Progress 480 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @1676'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 1196 1476 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1196' TO 1476'. 280'. ROP 23' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9' HIGH AND 7'RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 80% SLIDE 20%. TFO 10R.

18:00 06:00 12.0 1476 1676 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1476' TO 1676'. 200'. ROP 16.6' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE llK, WOB SLIDE 14K. ROTARY RPM 45, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 4' LOW AND 5'RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 70% SLIDE 30%. TFO OG.1
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RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346




ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: PPE AND SKID STEER SAFETY.


FUEL USED 1350 GALLONS.

01−17−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,728 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,728

Cum Costs: Drilling $153,528 Completion $0 Well Total $153,528

MD 2,066 TVD 2,033 Progress 390 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 2066’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 20:00 14.0 1676 2006 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1676’ TO 2006’. 330’. ROP 23.5’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18−20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26’ LOW AND 2’ LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.

20:00 23:30 3.5 0 0 WORK ON PUMP. START CLEANING MUD TANKS WHILE SHUT DOWN WORKING ON PUMP.

23:30 00:30 1.0 0 0 FINISH CLEANING MUD TANKS.

00:30 03:30 3.0 0 0 WORK STUCK PIPE AND CIRCULATE.


TRIPPED OFF BOTTOM 150’ BEFORE WORKING ON PUMP. ALSO MOVED PIPE EVERY 5−10 MIN
WHILE WORKING ON PUMP AND CLEANING TANKS. STARTED PUMPING TO TRIP BACK TO
BOTTOM, HAD FULL CIRCULATION BUT COULD NOT MOVE PIPE UP, DOWN, OR ROTATE.

03:30 06:00 2.5 2006 2066 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2006’ TO 2066’. 60’. ROP 24’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18−20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26’ LOW AND 2’ LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: SLIPS, TRIPS, & FALLS AND HIGH PRESSURE LINES.


FUEL USED 1100 GALLONS.

01−18−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,831 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,831

Cum Costs: Drilling $189,359 Completion $0 Well Total $189,359

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 207 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 2066 2096 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2066’ TO 2096’. (TRYING TO SLIDE).

09:30 12:00 2.5 2096 2096 CHANGE OUT UNION AT TOP OF POWER HEAD. (UNION WAS WASHED OUT).

12:00 17:00 5.0 2096 2273 DRILL ROTATE FROM 2096’ TO 2273’. 177’. ROP 35’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM 517. PSI 1200,
DIFF PSI 100. 59’ LOW AND 37’ LEFT OF LINE. TD @ 17:00 PM ON 01/17/2012.

17:00 18:30 1.5 2273 2273 CIRCULATE FOR WIPER TRIP.

18:30 21:30 3.0 2273 2273 TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS. A FEW TIGHT SPOTS FROM 1466’ OUT TO 986’.

21:30 22:30 1.0 2273 2273 WORK ON WINCH LINE ON RIG.

22:30 01:00 2.5 2273 2273 FINISH TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.
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Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: PPE AND SKID STEER SAFETY.1

FUEL USED 1350 GALLONS.

01-17-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,728 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,728

Cum Costs: Drilling $153,528 Completion $0 Well Total $153,528

MD 2,066 TVD 2,033 Progress 390 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @2066'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 20:00 14.0 1676 2006 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1676' TO 2006'. 330'. ROP 23.5' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18-20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26' LOW AND 2' LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.

20:00 23:30 3.5 0 0 WORK ON PUMP. START CLEANING MUD TANKS WHILE SHUT DOWN WORKING ON PUMP.

23:30 00:30 1.0 0 0 FINISH CLEANING MUD TANKS.

00:30 03:30 3.0 0 0 WORK STUCK PIPE AND CIRCULATE.1

TRIPPED OFF BOTTOM 150' BEFORE WORKING ON PUMP. ALSO MOVED PIPE EVERY 5-10 MIN
WHILE WORKING ON PUMP AND CLEANING TANKS. STARTED PUMPING TO TRIP BACK TO
BOTTOM, HAD FULL CIRCULATION BUT COULD NOT MOVE PIPE UP, DOWN, OR ROTATE.

03:30 06:00 2.5 2006 2066 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2006' TO 2066'. 60'. ROP 24' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18-20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26' LOW AND 2' LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: SLIPS, TRIPS, & FALLS AND HIGH PRESSURE LINES.I

FUEL USED 1100 GALLONS.

01-18-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,831 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,831

Cum Costs: Drilling $189,359 Completion $0 Well Total $189,359

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 207 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 2066 2096 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2066' TO 2096'. (TRYING TO SLIDE).

09:30 12:00 2.5 2096 2096 CHANGE OUT UNION AT TOP OF POWER HEAD. (UNION WAS WASHED OUT).

12:00 17:00 5.0 2096 2273 DRILL ROTATE FROM 2096' TO 2273'. 177'. ROP 35'FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM 517. PSI 1200,
DIFF PSI 100. 59' LOW AND 37' LEFT OF LINE. TD @17:00 PM ON 01/17/2012.

17:00 18:30 1.5 2273 2273 CIRCULATE FOR WIPER TRIP.

18:30 21:30 3.0 2273 2273 TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS. A FEW TIGHT SPOTS FROM 1466' OUT TO 986'.

21:30 22:30 1.0 2273 2273 WORK ON WINCH LINE ON RIG.

22:30 01:00 2.5 2273 2273 FINISH TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.
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RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

01:00 05:00 4.0 2273 2273 TALLY BHA WITH TRI−CONE AND REAMER. TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM.

05:00 06:00 1.0 2273 2273 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: TRIPPING PIPE AND WINCH LINE SAFTEY.


FUEL USED 850 GALLONS.

01−19−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $108,610 Completion $0 Daily Total $108,610

Cum Costs: Drilling $297,969 Completion $0 Well Total $297,969

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 0 0 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.

07:00 11:30 4.5 0 0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

11:30 13:30 2.0 0 0 RIG UP TO RUN CASING.

13:30 18:00 4.5 0 0 RUN 54 JTS (2244.69’) OF 9−5/8", 36.0#, K−55, ST&C CASING WITH HALLIBURTON GUIDE SHOE
AND FLOAT COLLAR. 12 CENTRALIZERS SPACED 10’ FROM THE SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2
AND #3 THEN EVERY 5TH COLLAR TO SURFACE. ALSO 2 CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @
2223.69’ TVD / 2263.69’ MD.

18:00 19:00 1.0 0 0 RUN 200’ OF 1" PIPE.

19:00 20:00 1.0 0 0 RDMO CRAIG’S PRESET RIG. RELEASE RIG @ 20:00 PM ON 01/18/12. MOVING TO CWU 1543−26D.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETINGS: TRIPPING PIPE AND RUNNING CASING.


FUEL USED 150 GALLONS.

20:00 06:00 10.0 0 0 CEMENT JOB: MIRU HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED
LINES AND CEMENT VALVE TO 4000 PSIG. PUMPED 30 BBLS FRESH WATER & 20 BBLS GELLED
WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT.





LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (183 BBLS) OF PREMIUM LEAD CEMENT WITH 0.3%
VERSASET, 2% CAL−SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @ 10.5 PPG WITH YIELD
OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT WITH 2%
CACL2 MIXED TAIL CEMENT @ 15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.2 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH
170 BBLS DIRTY WATER. BUMPED PLUG WITH 1000# @ 23:49 PM ON 01/18/12. FLOAT HELD.
SHUT−IN CASING VALVE. BROKE CIRCULATION 130 BBLS INTO LEAD CEMENT, LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE 70 BBLS INTO DISPLACEMENT. CIRCULATED ABOUT 100 BBLS OF LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE. WOC 1 HR 30 MIN.





TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 200’ OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL.





PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER
ACTIVITY.
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Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

01:00 05:00 4.0 2273 2273 TALLY BHA WITH TRI-CONE AND REAMER. TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM.

05:00 06:00 1.0 2273 2273 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.1

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: TRIPPING PIPE AND WINCH LINE SAFTEY.1

FUEL USED 850 GALLONS.

01-19-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $108,610 Completion $0 Daily Total $108,610

Cum Costs: Drilling $297,969 Completion $0 Well Total $297,969

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 0 0 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.

07:00 11:30 4.5 0 0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

11:30 13:30 2.0 0 0 RIG UP TO RUN CASING.

13:30 18:00 4.5 0 0 RUN 54 JTS (2244.69') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#, K-55, ST&C CASING WITH HALLIBURTON GUIDE SHOE
AND FLOAT COLLAR. 12 CENTRALIZERS SPACED 10'FROM THE SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2
AND #3 THEN EVERY 5TH COLLAR TO SURFACE. ALSO 2 CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @
2223.69' TVD / 2263.69' MD.

18:00 19:00 1.0 0 0 RUN 200' OF 1" PIPE.

19:00 20:00 1.0 0 0 RDMO CRAIG'S PRESET RIG. RELEASE RIG @20:00 PM ON 01/18/12. MOVING TO CWU 1543-26D.

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETINGS: TRIPPING PIPE AND RUNNING CASING.1

FUEL USED 150 GALLONS.

20:00 06:00 10.0 0 0 CEMENT JOB: MIRU HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED
LINES AND CEMENT VALVE TO 4000 PSIG. PUMPED 30 BBLS FRESH WATER & 20 BBLS GELLED
WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT.1

LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (183 BBLS) OF PREMIUM LEAD CEMENT WITH 0.3%
VERSASET, 2% CAL-SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @10.5 PPG WITH YIELD
OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT WITH 2%
CACL2 MIXED TAIL CEMENT @15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.2 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH
170 BBLS DIRTY WATER. BUMPED PLUG WITH 1000# @23:49 PM ON 01/18/12. FLOAT HELD.
SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. BROKE CIRCULATION 130 BBLS INTO LEAD CEMENT, LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE 70 BBLS INTO DISPLACEMENT. CIRCULATED ABOUT 100 BBLS OF LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE. WOC 1 HR 30 MIN.1

TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 200' OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL.I

PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER
ACTIVITY.1
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RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED BLM VIA E−MAIL OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON
01/17/12 @ 14:45 PM. KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELS WITH UDOGM VIA PHONE OF
THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 01/17/12 @ 14:45 PM.
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Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 23765 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED BLM VIA E-MAIL OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON
01/17/12 @14:45 PM. KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELS WITH UDOGM VIA PHONE OF
THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 01/17/12 @14:45 PM.
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RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



SUBMITAS EMAIL Print Form

BLM - Vernal Field Office - Notification Form

Operator EOG RESOURCES Rig Name/# TRUE 34
Submitted By JOHNNY TURNER Phone Number877-352-0710
Well Name/Number CWU 1544-26D
Qtr/QtrNE/NE Section 26 Township es Range 22E
Lease Serial Number UTUO285A
API Number 43-047-51731

Spud Notice -- Spud is the initial spudding of the well, not drilling
out below a casing string.

Date/Time AM PM

Casinq - Please report time casing run starts, not cementing
times.
O surfacecasing RECEIVED
O Intermediate Casing MAR2 O2012

Production Casing
O Liner DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

O Other

Date/Time 3-16-2012 16:00 AM PM

BOPE
O Initial BOPE test at surface casing point
O BOPE test at intermediate casing point

30 day BOPE test
Other

Date/Time AM PM

Remarks Approximate



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1544-26D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

4 /25 /2012

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The referenced well reached TD on 3-16-12, waiting on completion
operations. Please see the attached well chronology.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4 /25 /2012

May 09, 2012

Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1544-26D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0447 FNL 0501 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

4/25/2012
WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well reached TD on 3-16-12, waiting on completion Accepted by the
operations. Please see the attached well chronology. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
May 09, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/25/2012

RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED BLM VIA E−MAIL OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON
01/17/12 @ 14:45 PM. KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELS WITH UDOGM VIA PHONE OF
THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 01/17/12 @ 14:45 PM.

03−08−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,087 Completion $0 Daily Total $29,087

Cum Costs: Drilling $327,057 Completion $0 Well Total $327,057

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

22:00 00:00 2.0 0 0 RIG DOWN & SKID BACK 10’ TO CWU 1544−26D.

00:00 01:00 1.0 0 0 RIG UP.

01:00 02:00 1.0 0 0 NIPPLE UP BOP.  RIG ACCEPTED FOR DAYWORK @ 01:00 3/8/2012.


02:00 06:00 4.0 0 0 TEST UPPER & LOWER  KELLY VALVES, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE VALVES, CHOKE MANIFOLD,
CHECK VALVE, PIPE RAMS & BLIND RAMS TO 5000 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, ANNULAR 2500 PSI
HIGH, 250 LOW,  CASING 1500 PSI.


 


NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, SKIDDING RIG


FUEL 4144 GALS., USED 336 GALS.


TRANSFER 4480 GALS FROM THE CWU 1541−26D

03−09−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,792 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,792

Cum Costs: Drilling $368,849 Completion $0 Well Total $368,849

MD 3,400 TVD 3,340 Progress 1,117 Days 1 MW 10.5 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 3400’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 0 0 TEST CASING TO 1500#.

06:30 07:00 0.5 0 0 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.

07:00 08:00 1.0 0 0 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS & OREINT MWD.

08:00 10:00 2.0 0 0 PICK UP HWDP & TRIP IN HOLE W/ DRILLPIPE.

10:00 11:00 1.0 0 0 SLIP & CUT 95’ OF DRILLING LINE.

11:00 12:30 1.5 0 0 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP. & 10’ OF NEW HOLE.

12:30 13:00 0.5 2273 2283 F.I.T. TO 145# W/ 10.8 MUD WIEGHT= 12.0# ESTIMATED MUD WIEGHT.

13:00 16:30 3.5 2283 2578 ROTATE & SLIDE 2283’ − 2578’.= 295’, ROP 84.3 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68,  SPP 1325
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 457 GPM. 82% ROTATE, 18% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION TOP
2327’. SPUD @ 13:00 3/8/12.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 06:00 13.0 2578 3400 ROTATE & SLIDE 2578’ TO 3400.= 822’, ROP 63.2 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68,  SPP 1525
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 457 GPM. 62% ROTATE, 38% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS
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Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED BLM VIA E-MAIL OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON
01/17/12 @14:45 PM. KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELS WITH UDOGM VIA PHONE OF
THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 01/17/12 @14:45 PM.

03-08-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,087 Completion $0 Daily Total $29,087

Cum Costs: Drilling $327,057 Completion $0 Well Total $327,057

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

22:00 00:00 2.0 0 0 RIG DOWN & SKID BACK 10' TO CWU 1544-26D.

00:00 01:00 1.0 0 0 RIG UP.

01:00 02:00 1.0 0 0 NIPPLE UP BOP. RIG ACCEPTED FOR DAYWORK @01:00 3/8/2012.1

02:00 06:00 4.0 0 0 TEST UPPER & LOWER KELLY VALVES, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE VALVES, CHOKE MANIFOLD,
CHECK VALVE, PIPE RAMS & BLIND RAMS TO 5000 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, ANNULAR 2500 PSI
HIGH, 250 LOW, CASING 1500 PSI.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, SKIDDING RIGT

FUEL 4144 GALS., USED 336 GALS.I

TRANSFER 4480 GALS FROM THE CWU 1541-26D

03-09-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,792 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,792

Cum Costs: Drilling $368,849 Completion $0 Well Total $368,849

MD 3,400 TVD 3,340 Progress 1,117 Days 1 MW 10.5 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @3400'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 0 0 TEST CASING TO 1500#.

06:30 07:00 0.5 0 0 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.

07:00 08:00 1.0 0 0 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS & OREINT MWD.

08:00 10:00 2.0 0 0 PICK UP HWDP & TRIP IN HOLE W/ DRILLPIPE.

10:00 11:00 1.0 0 0 SLIP & CUT 95' OF DRILLING LINE.

11:00 12:30 1.5 0 0 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP. & 10' OF NEW HOLE.

12:30 13:00 0.5 2273 2283 F.I.T. TO 145# W/ 10.8 MUD WIEGHT= 12.0# ESTIMATED MUD WIEGHT.

13:00 16:30 3.5 2283 2578 ROTATE & SLIDE 2283' - 2578'.= 295', ROP 84.3 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68, SPP 1325
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 457 GPM. 82% ROTATE, 18% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION TOP
2327'. SPUD @13:00 3/8/12.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 06:00 13.0 2578 3400 ROTATE & SLIDE 2578' TO 3400.= 822', ROP 63.2 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68, SPP 1525
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 457 GPM. 62% ROTATE, 38% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

SAFETY MEETING, PICKING UP BHA, OPERATING FORK LIFT


COM CHECK TRIPPING & DRILLING


BOP DRILL NIGHT CREW


FUEL 2800 GALS., USED 1344 GALS.





06:00 0 0 SPUD 7 7/8’ SURFACE HOLE @ 13:00 HRS ON 3/8/12.

03−10−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $67,082 Completion $0 Daily Total $67,082

Cum Costs: Drilling $435,931 Completion $0 Well Total $435,931

MD 4,820 TVD 4,740 Progress 1,420 Days 2 MW 10.5 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 4820’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:00 10.0 3400 4136 ROTATE & SLIDE 3400’ TO 4136’.= 736’, ROP 73.6 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68,  SPP 1750
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 457 GPM. 82% ROTATE, 18% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327’, WASATCH 4705’.

16:00 16:30 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:30 06:00 13.5 4136 4820 ROTATE & SLIDE 4136’ TO 4820’.= 684’, ROP 50.7 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68,  SPP 2000
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 457 GPM. 83% ROTATE, 17% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327’, WASATCH 4705’, CHAPITA WELLS 5298’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, MIXING CHEMICALS, SERVICING RIG


COM CHECK DRILLING


BOP DRILL DAY CREW


FUEL 8624 GALS USED 1676


RECIEVED 7500 GALS OF FUEL

03−11−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $33,429 Completion $0 Daily Total $33,429

Cum Costs: Drilling $469,360 Completion $0 Well Total $469,360

MD 5,666 TVD 5,586 Progress 846 Days 3 MW 10.6 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING  @ 5666’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:30 10.5 4820 5229 ROTATE & SLIDE 4820’ TO 5229’ = 409’, ROP 38.9 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68,  SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 457 GPM. 98% ROTATE, 2% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705’, CHAPITA WELLS 5298’,
BUCK CANYON 5917’.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 02:00 9.0 5229 5557 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 5229’ TO 5557’ = 328’, ROP 36.4 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP
2050 PSI, DIFF. 100−350, 450 GPM. 96.5% ROTATE, 3.5% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705’, CHAPITA WELLS
5298’, BUCK CANYON 5917’.  MOVE CLOCK FORWARD FOR DLS.

03:00 06:00 3.0 5557 5666 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 5557’ TO 5666’ = 109’, ROP 36.3 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP
2050 PSI, DIFF. 100−350, 450 GPM. 89.5% ROTATE, 10.5% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705’, CHAPITA WELLS
5298’, BUCK CANYON 5917’.
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Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

SAFETY MEETING, PICKING UP BHA, OPERATING FORK LIFT E

COM CHECK TRIPPING & DRILLINGT

BOP DRILL NIGHT CREWT

FUEL 2800 GALS., USED 1344 GALS.I

06:00 0 0 SPUD 7 7/8' SURFACE HOLE @13:00 HRS ON 3/8/12.

03-10-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $67,082 Completion $0 Daily Total $67,082

Cum Costs: Drilling $435,931 Completion $0 Well Total $435,931

MD 4,820 TVD 4,740 Progress 1,420 Days 2 MW 10.5 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @4820'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:00 10.0 3400 4136 ROTATE & SLIDE 3400' TO 4136'.= 736', ROP 73.6 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68, SPP 1750
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 457 GPM. 82% ROTATE, 18% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327', WASATCH 4705'.

16:00 16:30 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:30 06:00 13.5 4136 4820 ROTATE & SLIDE 4136' TO 4820'.= 684', ROP 50.7 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68, SPP 2000
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 457 GPM. 83% ROTATE, 17% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327', WASATCH 4705', CHAPITA WELLS 5298'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, MIXING CHEMICALS, SERVICING RIGT

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

BOP DRILL DAY CREW T

FUEL 8624 GALS USED 16761

RECIEVED 7500 GALS OF FUEL

03-11-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $33,429 Completion $0 Daily Total $33,429

Cum Costs: Drilling $469,360 Completion $0 Well Total $469,360

MD 5,666 TVD 5,586 Progress 846 Days 3 MW 10.6 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @5666'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:30 10.5 4820 5229 ROTATE & SLIDE 4820' TO 5229' = 409', ROP 38.9 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68, SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 457 GPM. 98% ROTATE, 2% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705', CHAPITA WELLS 5298',
BUCK CANYON 5917'.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 02:00 9.0 5229 5557 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 5229' TO 5557' = 328', ROP 36.4 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP
2050 PSI, DIFF. 100-350, 450 GPM. 96.5% ROTATE, 3.5% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705', CHAPITA WELLS
5298', BUCK CANYON 5917'. MOVE CLOCK FORWARD FOR DLS.

03:00 06:00 3.0 5557 5666 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 5557' TO 5666' = 109', ROP 36.3 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP
2050 PSI, DIFF. 100-350, 450 GPM. 89.5% ROTATE, 10.5% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705', CHAPITA WELLS
5298', BUCK CANYON 5917'.I
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING, PROPER LIFTING, USING WINCHED


FUEL 6944 GALS, USED 1680 GALS.


LOST 1 HR DUE TO TIME CHANGE.

03−12−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,482 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,482

Cum Costs: Drilling $504,842 Completion $0 Well Total $504,842

MD 6,620 TVD 6,540 Progress 954 Days 4 MW 10.7 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 6620’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 5666 6072 ROTATE & SLIDE 5666’ TO 6072’ = 406’, ROP 42.7 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP 2100
PSI, DIFF. 100−350, 450 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE,CHAPITA WELLS 5298’,  BUCK CANYON
5917’, NORTH HORN 6698’.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 6072 6620 ROTATE & SLIDE 6072’ TO 6620’ = 548’, ROP 39.1 FPH, WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP 2150
PSI, DIFF. 100−350, 446 GPM. 96% ROTATE, 4% SLIDE, BUCK CANYON 5917’, NORTH HORN 6698’,
PRICE RIVER 7025’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, USING PRESSURE WASHER, CLEANING LIGHT PLANT.


COM CHECK DRILLING


FUEL 5152 GALS, USED 1792 GALS.

03−13−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $34,519 Completion $4,370 Daily Total $38,890

Cum Costs: Drilling $539,362 Completion $4,370 Well Total $543,733

MD 7,260 TVD 7,180 Progress 640 Days 5 MW 11.0 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 7260’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:30 10.5 6620 6919 ROTATE & SLIDE 6620’ TO 6919 = 299’, ROP 28.5 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP 2200
PSI, DIFF. 100−350, 446 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE, BUCK CANYON 5917’, NORTH HORN 6698’,
PRICE RIVER 7025’.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 06:00 13.0 6919 7260 ROTATE & SLIDE 6919’ TO 7260’ = 341’, ROP 26.2 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP 2200
PSI, DIFF. 80−350, 446 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE, NORTH HORN 6698’, PRICE RIVER 7025’,
PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, UNLOADING CASING, DRIVING TO & FROM WORK.


COM CHECK DRILLING.


FUEL 3420 GALS., USED 1732 GALS.
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Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING, PROPER LIFTING, USING WINCHEDI

FUEL 6944 GALS, USED 1680 GALS.I

LOST 1 HR DUE TO TIME CHANGE.

03-12-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,482 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,482

Cum Costs: Drilling $504,842 Completion $0 Well Total $504,842

MD 6,620 TVD 6,540 Progress 954 Days 4 MW 10.7 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @6620'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 5666 6072 ROTATE & SLIDE 5666' TO 6072' = 406', ROP 42.7 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP 2100
PSI, DIFF. 100-350, 450 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE,CHAPITA WELLS 5298', BUCK CANYON
5917', NORTH HORN 6698'.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 6072 6620 ROTATE & SLIDE 6072' TO 6620' = 548', ROP 39.1 FPH, WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP 2150
PSI, DIFF. 100-350, 446 GPM. 96% ROTATE, 4% SLIDE, BUCK CANYON 5917', NORTH HORN 6698',
PRICE RIVER 7025'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, USING PRESSURE WASHER, CLEANING LIGHT PLANT.1

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

FUEL 5152 GALS, USED 1792 GALS.

03-13-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $34,519 Completion $4,370 Daily Total $38,890

Cum Costs: Drilling $539,362 Completion $4,370 Well Total $543,733

MD 7,260 TVD 7,180 Progress 640 Days 5 MW 11.0 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @7260'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:30 10.5 6620 6919 ROTATE & SLIDE 6620' TO 6919 = 299', ROP 28.5 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP 2200
PSI, DIFF. 100-350, 446 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE, BUCK CANYON 5917', NORTH HORN 6698',
PRICE RIVER 7025'.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 06:00 13.0 6919 7260 ROTATE & SLIDE 6919' TO 7260' = 341', ROP 26.2 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP 2200
PSI, DIFF. 80-350, 446 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE, NORTH HORN 6698', PRICE RIVER 7025',
PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, UNLOADING CASING, DRIVING TO & FROM WORK.1

COM CHECK DRILLING.1

FUEL 3420 GALS., USED 1732 GALS.
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

03−14−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $70,569 Completion $0 Daily Total $70,569

Cum Costs: Drilling $609,932 Completion $4,370 Well Total $614,303

MD 8,015 TVD 7,935 Progress 755 Days 6 MW 11.1 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 8015’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 7260 7581 ROTATE & SLIDE 7260’ TO 7581’ = 321’, ROP 33.8 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 66,  SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 80−350, 442 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 7025’,  PRICE RIVER MIDDLE
7900’.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 7581 8015 ROTATE & SLIDE 7581’ TO 8015 = 434’, ROP 31 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 64,  SPP 2150 PSI,
DIFF. 80−350, 428 GPM. 97.5% ROTATE, 2.5% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 7025’,  PRICE RIVER MIDDLE
7900’, PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING, LAST DAY AWARENESS, LOCK OUT TAG OUT.


RECIEVED 7200 GALS FUEL


FUEL 8736 GALS, USED 1884 GALS.

03−15−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $55,759 Completion $2,135 Daily Total $57,895

Cum Costs: Drilling $665,692 Completion $6,506 Well Total $672,198

MD 8,682 TVD 8,602 Progress 667 Days 7 MW 11.4 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 8015 8392 ROTATE & SLIDE 8015’ TO 8392’ = 377’, ROP 41.9 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/65, MM 64,  SPP 2250
PSI, DIFF. 80−350, 428 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE,  PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900’, PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691’.

15:00 15:30 0.5 0 0 RIG SERVICE.

15:30 04:30 13.0 8392 8682 ROTATE & SLIDE 8392’ TO 8682’ = 290’, ROP 22.3 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 40/65, MM 64,  SPP 2250
PSI, DIFF. 80−350, 428 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE,  PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900’, PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691’, SEGO 9212’.

04:30 05:00 0.5 0 0 CIRCULATE & BUILD SLUG TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT#3.

05:00 06:00 1.0 0 0 PUMP DRY JOB, BLOW DOWN KELLY & TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #3.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPING


SAFETY MEETING, MIXING CHEMICALS,LOCK OUT TAG OUT


FUEL 6954 GALS., USED 1782 GALS

03−16−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,147 Completion $268 Daily Total $35,415
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Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

03-14-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $70,569 Completion $0 Daily Total $70,569

Cum Costs: Drilling $609,932 Completion $4,370 Well Total $614,303

MD 8,015 TVD 7,935 Progress 755 Days 6 MW 11.1 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @8015'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 7260 7581 ROTATE & SLIDE 7260' TO 7581' = 321', ROP 33.8 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 66, SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 80-350, 442 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 7025', PRICE RIVER MIDDLE
7900'.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 7581 8015 ROTATE & SLIDE 7581' TO 8015 = 434', ROP 31 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 64, SPP 2150 PSI,
DIFF. 80-350, 428 GPM. 97.5% ROTATE, 2.5% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 7025', PRICE RIVER MIDDLE
7900', PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING, LAST DAY AWARENESS, LOCK OUT TAG OUT.1

RECIEVED 7200 GALS FUELL

FUEL 8736 GALS, USED 1884 GALS.

03-15-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $55,759 Completion $2,135 Daily Total $57,895

Cum Costs: Drilling $665,692 Completion $6,506 Well Total $672,198

MD 8,682 TVD 8,602 Progress 667 Days 7 MW 11.4 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 8015 8392 ROTATE & SLIDE 8015' TO 8392' = 377', ROP 41.9 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/65, MM 64, SPP 2250
PSI, DIFF. 80-350, 428 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900', PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691'.

15:00 15:30 0.5 0 0 RIG SERVICE.

15:30 04:30 13.0 8392 8682 ROTATE & SLIDE 8392' TO 8682' = 290', ROP 22.3 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 40/65, MM 64, SPP 2250
PSI, DIFF. 80-350, 428 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900', PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691', SEGO 9212'.

04:30 05:00 0.5 0 0 CIRCULATE & BUILD SLUG TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT#3.

05:00 06:00 1.0 0 0 PUMP DRY JOB, BLOW DOWN KELLY & TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #3.1

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPINGT

SAFETY MEETING, MIXING CHEMICALS,LOCK OUT TAG OUTE

FUEL 6954 GALS., USED 1782 GALS

03-16-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,147 Completion $268 Daily Total $35,415
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

Cum Costs: Drilling $700,840 Completion $6,774 Well Total $707,614

MD 9,105 TVD 9,025 Progress 423 Days 8 MW 11.5 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 9105’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 0 0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE W/ BIT #3, (WORK TIGHT HOLE FROM 4600’ TO 4860’)

10:00 11:30 1.5 0 0 LAY DOWN BIT & MUD MOTOR, & MWD & REPROGRAM MWD.(FUNCTION BLIND RAMS)

11:30 17:00 5.5 0 0 PICK UP FRESH MUD MOTOR & BIT, SCRIBE MWD & TRIP IN HOLE (WASH THROUGH BRIDGES
@ 6840’, 7350’ & WASH 30’ TO BOTTOM.

17:00 18:30 1.5 8682 8737 ROTATE & SLIDE 8682’ TO 8737’  = 55’, ROP 36.7 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62,  SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 100−250, 411 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE,  PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900’, PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691’, SEGO 9212’.

18:30 19:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

19:00 06:00 11.0 8737 9105 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 8737’ TO 9105’  = 368’, ROP 33.5 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62,  SPP
2400 PSI, DIFF. 100−250, 412 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691’, SEGO
9212’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPING


SAFETY MEETING, MAKING CONNECTIONS, TRIPPING PIPE


FUEL 5700 GALS, USED 1254 GALS.

03−17−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $38,252 Completion $0 Daily Total $38,252

Cum Costs: Drilling $739,092 Completion $6,774 Well Total $745,867

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 286 Days 9 MW 12.0 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO LD DP

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 9105 9391 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 9105’ TO 9391’ = 286’, ROP 30.1 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62,  SPP
2375 PSI, DIFF. 100−250, 411 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691’, SEGO
9212’. TD @ 9391’ @ 16:00 3/16/2012.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 18:30 2.5 0 0 CIRCULATE @ TD (9391’) FOR WIPER TRIP.

18:30 22:00 3.5 0 0 PUMP DRY JOB & TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR WIPER TRIP.

22:00 23:00 1.0 0 0 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

23:00 03:30 4.5 0 0 MAKE UP BIT SUB & BIT & TRIP IN HOLE. FILL PIPE @ 2300’, 5173’, & 8380’.

03:30 04:00 0.5 0 0 WASH & REAM 50’ TO BOTTOM, 10’ OF FILL. 

04:00 06:00 2.0 0 0 CIRCULATE & CODITION HOLE TO LAY DOWN DRILLPIPE. 15−20’ FLARE FOR 20 MIN. W/
BOTTOMS UP.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, WORK PLACE SAFETY, TRIPPING & LAYING DOWN TOOLS


COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPING


FUEL 3990 GALS, USED 1910 GALS.
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Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

Cum Costs: Drilling $700,840 Completion $6,774 Well Total $707,614

MD 9,105 TVD 9,025 Progress 423 Days 8 MW 11.5 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @9105'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 0 0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE W/ BIT #3, (WORK TIGHT HOLE FROM 4600' TO 4860')

10:00 11:30 1.5 0 0 LAY DOWN BIT & MUD MOTOR, & MWD & REPROGRAM MWD.(FUNCTION BLIND RAMS)

11:30 17:00 5.5 0 0 PICK UP FRESH MUD MOTOR & BIT, SCRIBE MWD & TRIP IN HOLE (WASH THROUGH BRIDGES

@6840', 7350' & WASH 30' TO BOTTOM.

17:00 18:30 1.5 8682 8737 ROTATE & SLIDE 8682' TO 8737' = 55', ROP 36.7 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62, SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 100-250, 411 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900', PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691', SEGO 9212'.

18:30 19:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

19:00 06:00 11.0 8737 9105 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 8737' TO 9105' = 368', ROP 33.5 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62, SPP
2400 PSI, DIFF. 100-250, 412 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691', SEGO
9212'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPINGT

SAFETY MEETING, MAKING CONNECTIONS, TRIPPING PIPE I

FUEL 5700 GALS, USED 1254 GALS.

03-17-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $38,252 Completion $0 Daily Total $38,252

Cum Costs: Drilling $739,092 Completion $6,774 Well Total $745,867

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 286 Days 9 MW 12.0 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO LD DP

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 9105 9391 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 9105' TO 9391' = 286', ROP 30.1 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62, SPP
2375 PSI, DIFF. 100-250, 411 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691', SEGO
9212'. TD @9391' @16:00 3/16/2012.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 18:30 2.5 0 0 CIRCULATE @TD (9391') FOR WIPER TRIP.

18:30 22:00 3.5 0 0 PUMP DRY JOB & TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR WIPER TRIP.

22:00 23:00 1.0 0 0 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

23:00 03:30 4.5 0 0 MAKE UP BIT SUB & BIT & TRIP IN HOLE. FILL PIPE @2300', 5173', & 8380'.

03:30 04:00 0.5 0 0 WASH & REAM 50' TO BOTTOM, 10' OF FILL.

04:00 06:00 2.0 0 0 CIRCULATE & CODITION HOLE TO LAY DOWN DRILLPIPE. 15-20'FLARE FOR 20 MIN. W/
BOTTOMS UP.1

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, WORK PLACE SAFETY, TRIPPING & LAYING DOWN TOOLSI

COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPINGT

FUEL 3990 GALS, USED 1910 GALS.
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: Apr. 25, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

03−18−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $33,657 Completion $167,773 Daily Total $201,431

Cum Costs: Drilling $772,750 Completion $174,548 Well Total $947,298

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 12.0 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 11:30 5.5 0 0 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE & TRIP OUT, STAND BACK 11 STANDS OF DRILL PIPE, HWDP & DRILL
COLLARS.

11:30 12:00 0.5 0 0 PULL WEAR BUSHING.





12:00 19:30 7.5 0 0 RUN TOTAL OF 209 JTS OF CASING ( 207 FULL JTS  OF 4.5", 11.6#, N−80, LT&C + 2 MARKER
JOINTS 11.6#, P−110, LT&C) AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, 51 JTS OF
CASING, MARKER JOINT, @ TOP OF PRICE RIVER, 60 JTS, CASING, MARKER JOINT, @ 400’
ABOVE WASATCH, 95 JTS CASING. RAN 3 TURBILIZERS (5’ ABOVE SHOE AND MIDDLE OF JTS
#2 & #3) + 1 BOW CENTRALIZER EVERY 3RD JOINT THEREAFTER TO 400’ ABOVE WASATCH
(TOTAL OF 40) TAG BOTTOM , LAY DOWN TAG JOINT, PICK UP MANDREL & LAND CASING W/
82K STRING WEIGHT @ 9380’. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM W/ NO HOLE PROBLEMS.





CASING LANDED AS FOLLOWS (DEPTHS SHOWN ARE TOPS OF 


COMPONENTS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED):


FLOAT SHOE (BOTTOM): 9380’


FLOAT COLLAR: 9333’


MARKER JOINT: 7007’


MARKER JOINT: 4288’





19:30 23:00 3.5 0 0 CIRCULATE CASING ON BOTTOM, LAST 200 BBLS W/ 0.5 GPT ALDICIDE. 10−15’ FLARE FOR 20
MIN.

23:00 01:30 2.5 0 0 TEST LINE TO 7000#, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH WATER
W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 515 SKS (148 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61 YIELD W/ 4% BENTONITE, 0.3%
VERSASET, 0.5% HR−5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1345 SKS (352 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47 YIELD W/ 0.125
LBM POLY−E−FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 147 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5 GPT
MYACIDE, DISPLACED @ 8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 3 BBLS MIN W/ 137BBLS GONE, FCP 2320#,
BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3330#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT,  FLOATS HELD. FULL
RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB.

01:30 02:30 1.0 0 0 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# & HOLD ON CASING FOR 1 HR.

02:30 03:30 1.0 0 0 REMOVE CEMENT HEAD & LANDING JOINT, INSTALL PACKOFF & TEST TO 5000 PSI.

03:30 04:30 1.0 0 0 RIG DOWN TO MOVE TO CWU 1543−26D.

04:30 06:00 1.5 0 0 NIPPLE DOWN BOP.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING LAYING DOWN DRILLPIPE, RUNNING CASING


FUEL 3420 GALS, USED 570 GALS


TRANSFERED 3420 GALS FUEL TO CWU 1543−26D





06:00 0 0 RIG RELEASED @ 06:00 HRS, 3−18−2012.


CASING POINT COST $772,751
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Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25065 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

03-18-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $33,657 Completion $167,773 Daily Total $201,431

Cum Costs: Drilling $772,750 Completion $174,548 Well Total $947,298

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 12.0 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 11:30 5.5 0 0 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE & TRIP OUT, STAND BACK 11 STANDS OF DRILL PIPE, HWDP & DRILL
COLLARS.

11:30 12:00 0.5 0 0 PULL WEAR BUSHING. I

12:00 19:30 7.5 0 0 RUN TOTAL OF 209 JTS OF CASING ( 207 FULL JTS OF 4.5", 11.6#, N-80, LT&C + 2 MARKER
JOINTS 11.6#, P-110, LT&C) AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, 51 JTS OF
CASING, MARKER JOINT, @TOP OF PRICE RIVER, 60 JTS, CASING, MARKER JOINT, @400'
ABOVE WASATCH, 95 JTS CASING. RAN 3 TURBILIZERS (5'ABOVE SHOE AND MIDDLE OF JTS
#2 & #3) + 1 BOW CENTRALIZER EVERY 3RD JOINT THEREAFTER TO 400'ABOVE WASATCH
(TOTAL OF 40) TAG BOTTOM , LAY DOWN TAG JOINT, PICK UP MANDREL & LAND CASING W/
82K STRING WEIGHT @9380'. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM W/ NO HOLE PROBLEMS.I

CASING LANDED AS FOLLOWS (DEPTHS SHOWN ARE TOPS OF I

COMPONENTS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED):I

FLOAT SHOE (BOTTOM): 9380'l

FLOAT COLLAR: 9333'l

MARKER JOINT: 7007'l

MARKER JOINT: 4288'l

19:30 23:00 3.5 0 0 CIRCULATE CASING ON BOTTOM, LAST 200 BBLS W/ 0.5 GPT ALDICIDE. 10-15'FLARE FOR 20
MIN.

23:00 01:30 2.5 0 0 TEST LINE TO 7000#, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH WATER
W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 515 SKS (148 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61YIELD W/ 4% BENTONITE, 0.3%
VERSASET, 0.5% HR-5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1345 SKS (352 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47YIELD W/ 0.125
LBM POLY-E-FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 147 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5 GPT
MYACIDE, DISPLACED @8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 3 BBLS MIN W/ 137BBLS GONE, FCP 2320#,
BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3330#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT, FLOATS HELD. FULL
RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB.

01:30 02:30 1.0 0 0 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# & HOLD ON CASING FOR 1 HR.

02:30 03:30 1.0 0 0 REMOVE CEMENT HEAD & LANDING JOINT, INSTALL PACKOFF & TEST TO 5000 PSI.

03:30 04:30 1.0 0 0 RIG DOWN TO MOVE TO CWU 1543-26D.

04:30 06:00 1.5 0 0 NIPPLE DOWN BOP.1

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING LAYING DOWN DRILLPIPE, RUNNING CA SINGT

FUEL 3420 GALS, USED 570 GALSI

TRANSFERED 3420 GALS FUEL TO CWU 1543-26DI

06:00 0 0 RIG RELEASED @06:00 HRS, 3-18-2012.1

CASING POINT COST $772,751
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RECEIVED: Apr. 25,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1544-26D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

5 /21 /2012

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Completion operations for the referenced well began on 5-12-12.
Please see the attached well chronology. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /21 /2012

May 21, 2012

Sundry Number: 25906 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25906 API Well Number: 43047517310000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1544-26D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0447 FNL 0501 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

5/21/2012
WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Completion operations for the referenced well began on 5-12-12.
Accepted by the

Please see the attached well chronology. Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
May 21, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/21/2012

RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

04−12−2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $16,000 Daily Total $16,000

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,548 Well Total $972,779

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. LOG WITH CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FORM 9317’ TO 70’. EST CEMENT TOP
@ 1100’. RDWL.

05−12−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $205 Daily Total $205

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,753 Well Total $972,984

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8839’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 FRAC TANKS PRE MIXED W/BIOCIDE (BE 6) @ 3# PER TANK.





STAGE 1. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE & MIRU HALLIBURTON, PERFORATE LPR FROM 9066’−67’,
9055’−56’, 8992’−93’, 8965’−66’, 8942’−43’, 8911’−12’, 8888’−89’, 8875’−76’, 8865’−66’, 8857’−58’,
8846’−47’, 8839’−40’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL
OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO
6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON
KW31 @ 2GPT), 592 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7440 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5
PPG, 23775 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/ 80300# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5704 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM.
ATP 4415 PSIG. ATR 48 BPM. ISIP 2694 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN. 

05−13−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $205 Daily Total $205

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,958 Well Total $973,189

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8436’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 STAGE 2. SICP 2106 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8820’. PERFORATE MPR/LPR FROM 8802’−03,
8791’−92’, 8785’−86’, 8774’−75’, 8752’−53’, 8740’−41’, 8696’−97’, 8686’−87’, 8674’−75’, 8653’−54’,
8645’−46’, 8636’−37’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31
@ 2GPT). 803 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7433 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG,
35052 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/120300# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5506 PSIG. MTR 50.5 BPM. ATP
4129 PSIG. ATR 49.6 BPM. ISIP 3255 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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Sundry Number: 25906 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25906 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

04-12-2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $16,000 Daily Total $16,000

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,548 Well Total $972,779

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. LOG WITH CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FORM 9317' TO 70'. EST CEMENT TOP

@1100'. RDWL.

05-12-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $205 Daily Total $205

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,753 Well Total $972,984

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8839'-906T PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 FRAC TANKS PRE MIXED W/BIOCIDE (BE 6) @3# PER TANK.

STAGE 1. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE & MIRU HALLIBURTON, PERFORATE LPR FROM 9066'-67',
9055'-56', 8992'-93', 8965'-66', 8942'-43', 8911'-12', 8888'-89', 8875'-76', 8865'-66', 8857'-58',
8846'-47', 8839'-40' @3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL
OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO
6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON
KW31 @2GPT), 592 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7440 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5

PPG, 23775 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/ 80300# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5704 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM.
ATP 4415 PSIG. ATR 48 BPM. ISIP 2694 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05-13-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $205 Daily Total $205

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,958 Well Total $973,189

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8436'-9067' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 STAGE 2. SICP 2106 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8820'. PERFORATE MPR/LPR FROM 8802'-03,
8791'-92', 8785'-86', 8774'-75', 8752'-53', 8740'-41', 8696'-97', 8686'-87', 8674'-75', 8653'-54',
8645'-46', 8636'-37' @3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31

@2GPT). 803 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7433 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG,
35052 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/120300# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5506 PSIG. MTR 50.5 BPM. ATP
4129 PSIG. ATR 49.6 BPM. ISIP 3255 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

STAGE 3. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8612’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8588’−89’, 8576’−77’, 8567’−68’,
8553’−54’, 8541’−42’, 8526’−27, 8520’−21’, 8502’−03, 8475’−76’, 8463’−64’, 8444’−45’, 8436’−37’ @ 3
SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE
INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106 PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH
WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 718 GAL 16#
LINEAR PAD,  7430 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 35491 GAL 16# DELTA 200
W/122300# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5884 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP 4424 PSIG. ATR 49.3 BPM.
ISIP 3085 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05−14−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $376,787 Daily Total $376,787

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $567,745 Well Total $1,349,977

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU CLEAN OUT SAND AND DRILL OUT FRAC PLUGS.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 0 0 STAGE 4. INTIAL PRESSURE 1856 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8422’. PERFORATE MPR FROM
8401’−02’, 8391’−92’, 8362’−63’, 8353’−54’, 8339’−40’, 8328’−29’, 8314’−15’, 8301’−02’, 8291’−92’,
8276’−77’, 8265’−66’, 8250’−51’@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD
PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55
GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL
BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 750 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7412 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500#
20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 44403 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/153800# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5563
PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 3857 PSIG. ATR 50 BPM. ISIP 3232 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 5. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8212’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8191’−92’, 8181’−82’, 8166’−67’,
8156’−57’, 8143’−44’, 8128’−29’, 8117’−18’, 8096’−97’, 8081’−82’, 8072’−73’, 8058’−59’, 8038’−39’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 951
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7394 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 53724 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/186900# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 4924 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 3541 PSIG. ATR
50 BPM. ISIP 2488 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 6. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8014’. PERFORATE UPR/MPR FROM 7994’−95’, 7966’−67’,
7953’−54’, 7909’−10’, (7903’−04’MISFIRED), 7891’−92’, 7880’−81’, 7868’−69’, 7849’−50’, 7840’−41’,
7820’−21’, 7795’−96’@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106,
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31
@ 2GPT), 1021 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7427 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG,
31262 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/107100# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5665 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP
4010 PSIG. ATR 49.5 BPM. ISIP 2497 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 7. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7770’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7748’−49’, 7736’−37’, 7721’−22’,
7715’−16’, 7699’−7700’, 7645’−46’, 7616’−17’, 7594’−95’, 7585’−86’, 7574’−75’, 7525’−26’, 7513’−14’@
3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 740
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7425 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 32205 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/110000# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5414 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 3924 PSIG. ATR
49.9 BPM. ISIP 2670 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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Sundry Number: 25906 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25906 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

STAGE 3. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8612'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8588'-89', 8576'-77', 8567'-68',
8553'-54', 8541'-42', 8526'-27, 8520'-21', 8502'-03, 8475'-76', 8463'-64', 8444'-45', 8436'-37' @3
SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE
INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106 PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH
WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 718 GAL 16#
LINEAR PAD, 7430 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 35491 GAL 16# DELTA 200
W/122300# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5884 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP 4424 PSIG. ATR 49.3 BPM.
ISIP 3085 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05-14-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $376,787 Daily Total $376,787

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $567,745 Well Total $1,349,977

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050'-906T PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU CLEAN OUT SAND AND DRILL OUT FRAC PLUGS.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 0 0 STAGE 4. INTIAL PRESSURE 1856 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8422'. PERFORATE MPR FROM
8401'-02', 8391'-92', 8362'-63', 8353'-54', 8339'-40', 8328'-29', 8314'-15', 8301'-02', 8291'-92',
8276'-77', 8265'-66', 8250'-51'@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD
PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55
GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL
BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 750 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7412 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500#
20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 44403 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/153800# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5563
PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 3857 PSIG. ATR 50 BPM. ISIP 3232 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 5. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8212'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8191'-92', 8181'-82', 8166'-67',
8156'-57', 8143'-44', 8128'-29', 8117'-18', 8096'-97', 8081'-82', 8072'-73', 8058'-59', 8038'-39'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 951
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7394 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 53724 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/186900# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 4924 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 3541 PSIG. ATR
50 BPM. ISIP 2488 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 6. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8014'. PERFORATE UPR/MPR FROM 7994'-95', 7966'-67',
7953'-54', 7909'-10', (7903'-04'MISFIRED), 7891'-92', 7880'-81', 7868'-69', 7849'-50', 7840'-41',
7820'-21', 7795'-96'@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106,
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31

@2GPT), 1021 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7427 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG,
31262 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/107100# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5665 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP
4010 PSIG. ATR 49.5 BPM. ISIP 2497 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 7. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7770'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7748'-49', 7736'-37', 7721'-22',
7715'-16', 7699'-7700', 7645'-46', 7616'-17', 7594'-95', 7585'-86', 7574'-75', 7525'-26', 7513'-14'@
3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 740
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7425 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 32205 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/110000# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5414 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 3924 PSIG. ATR
49.9 BPM. ISIP 2670 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 21, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

12:00 06:00 18.0 0 0 STAGE 8. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7478’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7456’−57’, 7446’−47’, 7435’−36’,
7418’−19’, 7407’−08’, 7393’−94’, 7382’−83’, 7357’−58’, 7348’−49’, 7338’−39’, 7321’−22’, 7292’−93’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 983
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7469 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 27988 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/95600# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5930 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4361 PSIG. ATR
47.2 BPM. ISIP 2222 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 9. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7252’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7230’−31’, 7220’−21’, 7210’−11’,
7202’−03’, 7183’−84’, 7131’−32’, 7116’−17’, 7093’−94’, 7084’−85, 7076’−77’, 7064’−65’, 7050’−51’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 372
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7446 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 36218 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/124500# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 4545 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 3455 PSIG. ATR
48.1 BPM. ISIP 1881 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 7000’. BLED WELL TO 0 PSIG. RDMO CUTTERS WIRELINE &
HALIBURTON SERVICES. SWIFN.

05−18−2012 Reported By BAUSCH / BASTAIN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $58,712 Daily Total $58,712

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $626,457 Well Total $1,408,689

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POST FRAC CLEAN OUT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

18:00 06:00 12.0 0 0 MIRUSU. SICP 0 PSIG. ND FRAC VALVES. NU BOPE. PRESSURE TEST BOP & FLOWLINES TO 2000
PSIG. RIH W/POBS TO CBP @ 7000’. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @ 7000’, 7252’, 7478’,
7770’, 8014’, 8212’ & 8422’. 

05−19−2012 Reported By BAUSCH / BASTAIN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $21,275 Daily Total $21,275

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $647,732 Well Total $1,429,964

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 DRILLED OUT PLUGS @ 8612’ & 8820’. CLEANED OUT TO PBTD @ 9130’. LANDED TBG AT 7716’
KB.  ND BOPE. NU TREE. PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB. RDMOSU.





TUBING DETAIL 				LENGTH





PUMP OFF SUB				1.00’


1 JT 2−3/8 4.7# L−80 TBG			32.67’


XN NIPPLE				1.30’ @ 7681’


235 JTS 2−3/8 4.7# L−80 TBG			7662.22’


BELOW KB				19.00’	


LANDED @				7716.19’ KB
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Sundry Number: 25906 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25906 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

12:00 06:00 18.0 0 0 STAGE 8. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7478'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7456'-57', 7446'-47', 7435'-36',
7418'-19', 7407'-08', 7393'-94', 7382'-83', 7357'-58', 7348'-49', 7338'-39', 7321'-22', 7292'-93'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 983
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7469 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 27988 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/95600# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5930 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4361 PSIG. ATR
47.2 BPM. ISIP 2222 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 9. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7252'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7230'-31', 7220'-21', 7210'-11',
7202'-03', 7183'-84', 7131'-32', 7116'-17', 7093'-94', 7084'-85, 7076'-77', 7064'-65', 7050'-51'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 372
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7446 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 36218 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/124500# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 4545 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 3455 PSIG. ATR
48.1 BPM. ISIP 1881 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 7000'. BLED WELL TO 0 PSIG. RDMO CUTTERS WIRELINE &
HALIBURTON SERVICES. SWIFN.

05-18-2012 Reported By BAUSCH / BASTAIN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $58,712 Daily Total $58,712

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $626,457 Well Total $1,408,689

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050'-906T PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POST FRAC CLEAN OUT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

18:00 06:00 12.0 0 0 MIRUSU. SICP 0 PSIG. ND FRAC VALVES. NU BOPE. PRESSURE TEST BOP & FLOWLINES TO 2000
PSIG. RIH W/POBS TO CBP @7000'. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @7000', 7252', 7478',
7770', 8014', 8212' & 8422'.

05-19-2012 Reported By BAUSCH / BASTAIN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $21,275 Daily Total $21,275

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $647,732 Well Total $1,429,964

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050'-906T PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 DRILLED OUT PLUGS @8612' & 8820'. CLEANED OUT TO PBTD @9130'. LANDED TBGAT 7716'
KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB. RDMOSU.1

TUBINGDETAIL ]ILENGTHE

PUMP OFF SUB .00'l

1 JT 2-3/8 4.7# L-80 TBG]32.67'l

XN NIPPLE .30' @7681'l

235 JTS 2-3/8 4.7# L-80 TBG]7662.22'l

BELOW KB Il9.00'

LANDED @ 17716.19' KB
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RECEIVED: May. 21,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU0285A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1544-26D 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0447 FNL 0501 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

5 /21 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  05/21 /2012

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The referenced well was turned to sales on 05/21/2012. Please see the
attached operations summary report for drilling and completion

operations performed on the subject well.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /23 /2012

May 23, 2012

Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTUO285A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1544-26D

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047517310000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0447 FNL 0501 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENE Section: 26 Township: 09.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/21/2012
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: 05/21/2012

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was turned to sales on 05/21/2012. Please see the Accepted by the
attached operations summary report for drilling and completion Utah Division of

operations performed on the subject well. Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
May 23, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/23/2012

RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 05−23−2012

Well Name CWU 1544−26D Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43−047−51731 Well Class 1SA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 03−08−2012 Class Date 05−21−2012

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9,310/ 9,415 Property # 066346

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 7,716/ 7,716

KB / GL Elev 5,034/ 5,015

Location Section 26−T9S−R22E, NENE, 447 FNL & 501 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.139

AFE No 310498 AFE Total 1,598,100 DHC / CWC 751,800/ 846,300

Rig Contr POWELL SER.
INC

Rig Name RIG 1 Start Date 05−18−2012 Release Date 05−18−2012

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #34 Start Date 12−01−2011 Release Date 03−18−2012

12−01−2011 Reported By SHARON CAUDILL

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION DATA


447’ FNL & 501’ FEL (NE/NE)


SECTION 26, T9S, R22E


UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH





LAT 40 DEG 00’ 46.84", LONG 109 DEG 23’ 58.35"  (NAD 83)


LAT 40 DEG 00’ 46.96", LONG 109 DEG 23’ 55.90"  (NAD 27)





BHL: 1240’ FNL & 501’ FEL (NENE)


SECTION 26, T9S, R22E


UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH





TRUE #34


OBJECTIVE: 9415’ MD, 9310’ TVD, MESAVERDE


DW/GAS


CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECT


DD&A:  CHAPITA DEEP


NATURAL BUTTES FIELD





Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 05-23-2012

Well Name CWU 1544-26D Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43-047-51731 Well Class 1SA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 03-08-2012 Class Date 05-21-2012

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9,310/ 9,415 Property # 066346

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 7,716/7,716

KB / GL Elev 5,034/ 5,015

Location Section 26-T9S-R22E, NENE, 447 FNL & 501 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.139

AFE No 310498 AFE Total 1,598,100 DHC / CWC 751,800/ 846,300

Rig Contr POWELL SER. Rig Name RIG 1 Start Date 05-18-2012 Release Date 05-18-2012

INC

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #34 Start Date 12-01-2011 Release Date 03-18-2012

12-01-2011 Reported By SHARON CAUDILL

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION DATA I

447' FNL & 501' FEL (NE/NE) I

SECTION 26, T9S, R22El

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAHL

LAT 40 DEG 00'46.84", LONG 109 DEG 23' 58.35" (NAD 83)T

LAT 40 DEG 00'46.96", LONG 109 DEG 23' 55.90" (NAD 27)T

BHL: 1240'FNL & 501'FEL (NENE)T

SECTION 26, T9S, R22El

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAHL

TRUE #341

OBJECTIVE: 9415' MD, 9310' TVD, MESAVERDE T

DW/GAS T

CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECTI

DD&A: CHAPITADEEPT

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD E

RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

LEASE: FEDERAL UTU0285A


ELEVATION: 5015.3’ NAT GL, 5015.3’ PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL IS 5015’), 5034’ KB
(19’)


MULTI PAD CWU 1541−26D, CWU 1542−26DX, CWU 1543−26D, CWU 1544−26D, CWU 1545−26D,
CWU 1546−26D





EOG WI 100%, NRI 82.139316%

12−19−2011 Reported By GERALD ASHCRAFT/ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Daily Total $53,700

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION/LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 60 CRAIG’S BUCKET RIG SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 12/18/11 @ 08:00 AM, SET 60’ OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX.





BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 12/16/11 @ 10:58 AM.

06:00 0 0 LOCATION BUILD STARTED 12/16/11. PUSHING ON LOCATION (55% COMPLETE).

12−20−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 75% COMPLETE.

12−21−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 80% COMPLETE.

12−22−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

LEASE: FEDERAL UTU0285A

ELEVATION: 5015.3' NAT GL, 5015.3' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL IS 5015'), 5034' KB
(19')

MULTI PAD CWU 1541-26D, CWU 1542-26DX, CWU 1543-26D, CWU 1544-26D, CWU 1545-26D,
CWU 1546-26D

EOG WI 100%, NRI 82.139316%

12-19-2011 Reported By GERALD ASHCRAFT/ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Daily Total $53,700

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION/LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 60 CRAIG'S BUCKET RIG SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 12/18/11 @08:00 AM, SET 60' OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX.

BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 12/16/11 @10:58 AM.

06:00 0 0 LOCATION BUILD STARTED 12/16/11. PUSHING ON LOCATION (55% COMPLETE).

12-20-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 75% COMPLETE.

12-21-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 80% COMPLETE.

12-22-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE.

12−23−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL.

12−26−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 90% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL

12−27−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 WAITING ON AIR RIG, HAULING MATERIAL FOR CLOSED LOOP.

12−28−2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 100%. FINISH UP CLOSED LOOP TODAY.

01−14−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $17,455 Completion $0 Daily Total $17,455

Cum Costs: Drilling $71,155 Completion $0 Well Total $71,155

MD 386 TVD 386 Progress 67 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 386’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

Page 3

Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE.

12-23-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 85% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL.

12-26-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 90% COMPLETE. HAULING CLOSED LOOP MATERIAL

12-27-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 WAITING ON AIR RIG, HAULING MATERIAL FOR CLOSED LOOP.

12-28-2011 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $53,700 Completion $0 Well Total $53,700

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION BUILD

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 LOCATION IS 100%. FINISH UP CLOSED LOOP TODAY

01-14-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $17,455 Completion $0 Daily Total $17,455

Cum Costs: Drilling $71,155 Completion $0 Well Total $71,155

MD 386 TVD 386 Progress 67 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @386'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

16:00 23:00 7.0 0 0 MURI ON CWU 1544−26D.

23:00 23:30 0.5 0 0 RIG ON DAY WORK @ 23:00 PM ON 01/13/2012.


TALLY BHA.


WELL PREDRILLED FROM 79’ TO 319’ KOP.


THIS WELL PLANNED AZIMUTH 188.62*, INC 19.00*.


MUD MOTOR 1.75 DEGREE BEND, RPG .16, BIT TO BEND 7.08’, BIT TO MWD 59’.

23:30 04:00 4.5 0 0 PICK UP BHA AND ORIENT MWD. TRIP IN HOLE TO 319’ KOP.

04:00 06:00 2.0 319 386 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 319’ TO 386’. 67’. ROP 33.5’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 8K, WOB SLIDE 8K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 600, DIFF PSI 100.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: RIGGING UP.


FUEL USED 300 GALLONS.

01−15−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,756 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,756

Cum Costs: Drilling $98,911 Completion $0 Well Total $98,911

MD 1,196 TVD 1,187 Progress 810 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 1196’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 386 836 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 386’ TO 836’. 450’. ROP 37.5’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 900, DIFF PSI 50. 2’ LOW AND 5’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 17% SLIDE 83%. TFO 20L.

18:00 06:00 12.0 836 1196 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 836’ TO 1196’. 360’. ROP 30’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 10K, WOB SLIDE 12K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9’ HIGH AND 9’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 38% SLIDE 62%. TFO 30L.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: MAKING CONNECTIONS AND PUMP SAFETY.


FUEL USED 1000 GALLONS.

01−16−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $26,889 Completion $0 Daily Total $26,889

Cum Costs: Drilling $125,800 Completion $0 Well Total $125,800

MD 1,676 TVD 1,651 Progress 480 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 1676’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 1196 1476 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1196’ TO 1476’. 280’. ROP 23’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9’ HIGH AND 7’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 80% SLIDE 20%. TFO 10R.

18:00 06:00 12.0 1476 1676 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1476’ TO 1676’. 200’. ROP 16.6’ FPH.
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

16:00 23:00 7.0 0 0 MURI ON CWU 1544-26D.

23:00 23:30 0.5 0 0 RIG ON DAY WORK @23:00 PM ON 01/13/2012.1

TALLY BHA.I

WELL PREDRILLED FROM 79' TO 319' KOP.1

THIS WELL PLANNED AZIMUTH 188.62*, INC 19.00*.1

MUD MOTOR 1.75 DEGREE BEND, RPG .16, BIT TO BEND 7.08', BIT TO MWD 59'.

23:30 04:00 4.5 0 0 PICK UP BHA AND ORIENT MWD. TRIP IN HOLE TO 319' KOP.

04:00 06:00 2.0 319 386 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 319' TO 386'. 67'. ROP 33.5'FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 8K, WOB SLIDE 8K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 600, DIFF PSI 100.1

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: RIGGING UP.1

FUEL USED 300 GALLONS.

01-15-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,756 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,756

Cum Costs: Drilling $98,911 Completion $0 Well Total $98,911

MD 1,196 TVD 1,187 Progress 810 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @1196'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 386 836 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 386' TO 836'. 450'. ROP 37.5'FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 900, DIFF PSI 50. 2' LOW AND 5' RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 17% SLIDE 83%. TFO 20L.

18:00 06:00 12.0 836 1196 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 836' TO 1196'. 360'. ROP 30' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 10K, WOB SLIDE 12K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9' HIGH AND 9'RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 38% SLIDE 62%. TFO 30L.I

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: MAKING CONNECTIONS AND PUMP SAFETY.1

FUEL USED 1000 GALLONS.

01-16-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $26,889 Completion $0 Daily Total $26,889

Cum Costs: Drilling $125,800 Completion $0 Well Total $125,800

MD 1,676 TVD 1,651 Progress 480 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @1676'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 1196 1476 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1196' TO 1476'. 280'. ROP 23' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 12K, WOB SLIDE 15K. ROTARY RPM 40, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1000, DIFF PSI 100. 9' HIGH AND 7'RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 80% SLIDE 20%. TFO 10R.

18:00 06:00 12.0 1476 1676 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1476' TO 1676'. 200'. ROP 16.6' FPH.1
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

WOB ROTATE 11K, WOB SLIDE 14K. ROTARY RPM 45, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 4’ LOW AND 5’ RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 70% SLIDE 30%. TFO 0G.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: PPE AND SKID STEER SAFETY.


FUEL USED 1350 GALLONS.

01−17−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,728 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,728

Cum Costs: Drilling $153,528 Completion $0 Well Total $153,528

MD 2,066 TVD 2,033 Progress 390 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 2066’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 20:00 14.0 1676 2006 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1676’ TO 2006’. 330’. ROP 23.5’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18−20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26’ LOW AND 2’ LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.

20:00 23:30 3.5 0 0 WORK ON PUMP. START CLEANING MUD TANKS WHILE SHUT DOWN WORKING ON PUMP.

23:30 00:30 1.0 0 0 FINISH CLEANING MUD TANKS.

00:30 03:30 3.0 0 0 WORK STUCK PIPE AND CIRCULATE.


TRIPPED OFF BOTTOM 150’ BEFORE WORKING ON PUMP. ALSO MOVED PIPE EVERY 5−10 MIN
WHILE WORKING ON PUMP AND CLEANING TANKS. STARTED PUMPING TO TRIP BACK TO
BOTTOM, HAD FULL CIRCULATION BUT COULD NOT MOVE PIPE UP, DOWN, OR ROTATE.

03:30 06:00 2.5 2006 2066 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2006’ TO 2066’. 60’. ROP 24’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18−20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26’ LOW AND 2’ LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: SLIPS, TRIPS, & FALLS AND HIGH PRESSURE LINES.


FUEL USED 1100 GALLONS.

01−18−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,831 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,831

Cum Costs: Drilling $189,359 Completion $0 Well Total $189,359

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 207 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 2066 2096 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2066’ TO 2096’. (TRYING TO SLIDE).

09:30 12:00 2.5 2096 2096 CHANGE OUT UNION AT TOP OF POWER HEAD. (UNION WAS WASHED OUT).

12:00 17:00 5.0 2096 2273 DRILL ROTATE FROM 2096’ TO 2273’. 177’. ROP 35’ FPH.


WOB ROTATE 20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM 517. PSI 1200,
DIFF PSI 100. 59’ LOW AND 37’ LEFT OF LINE. TD @ 17:00 PM ON 01/17/2012.

17:00 18:30 1.5 2273 2273 CIRCULATE FOR WIPER TRIP.

18:30 21:30 3.0 2273 2273 TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS. A FEW TIGHT SPOTS FROM 1466’ OUT TO 986’.

Page 5

Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

WOB ROTATE llK, WOB SLIDE 14K. ROTARY RPM 45, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM
517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 4' LOW AND 5'RIGHT OF LINE. ROTATE 70% SLIDE 30%. TFO OG.1

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: PPE AND SKID STEER SAFETY.1

FUEL USED 1350 GALLONS.

01-17-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,728 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,728

Cum Costs: Drilling $153,528 Completion $0 Well Total $153,528

MD 2,066 TVD 2,033 Progress 390 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @2066'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 20:00 14.0 1676 2006 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 1676' TO 2006'. 330'. ROP 23.5' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18-20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26' LOW AND 2' LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.

20:00 23:30 3.5 0 0 WORK ON PUMP. START CLEANING MUD TANKS WHILE SHUT DOWN WORKING ON PUMP.

23:30 00:30 1.0 0 0 FINISH CLEANING MUD TANKS.

00:30 03:30 3.0 0 0 WORK STUCK PIPE AND CIRCULATE.1

TRIPPED OFF BOTTOM 150' BEFORE WORKING ON PUMP. ALSO MOVED PIPE EVERY 5-10 MIN
WHILE WORKING ON PUMP AND CLEANING TANKS. STARTED PUMPING TO TRIP BACK TO
BOTTOM, HAD FULL CIRCULATION BUT COULD NOT MOVE PIPE UP, DOWN, OR ROTATE.

03:30 06:00 2.5 2006 2066 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2006' TO 2066'. 60'. ROP 24' FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 20K, WOB SLIDE 18-20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136,
GPM 517. PSI 1200, DIFF PSI 100. 26' LOW AND 2' LEFT OF LINE. ROTATE 88% SLIDE 12%. TFO 10R.

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: SLIPS, TRIPS, & FALLS AND HIGH PRESSURE LINES.I

FUEL USED 1100 GALLONS.

01-18-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,831 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,831

Cum Costs: Drilling $189,359 Completion $0 Well Total $189,359

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 207 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 2066 2096 DRILL ROTATE AND SLIDE FROM 2066' TO 2096'. (TRYING TO SLIDE).

09:30 12:00 2.5 2096 2096 CHANGE OUT UNION AT TOP OF POWER HEAD. (UNION WAS WASHED OUT).

12:00 17:00 5.0 2096 2273 DRILL ROTATE FROM 2096' TO 2273'. 177'. ROP 35'FPH.1

WOB ROTATE 20K. ROTARY RPM 20, MOTOR RPM 83. PUMP STROKES 136, GPM 517. PSI 1200,
DIFF PSI 100. 59' LOW AND 37' LEFT OF LINE. TD @17:00 PM ON 01/17/2012.

17:00 18:30 1.5 2273 2273 CIRCULATE FOR WIPER TRIP.

18:30 21:30 3.0 2273 2273 TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS. A FEW TIGHT SPOTS FROM 1466' OUT TO 986'.
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

21:30 22:30 1.0 2273 2273 WORK ON WINCH LINE ON RIG.

22:30 01:00 2.5 2273 2273 FINISH TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

01:00 05:00 4.0 2273 2273 TALLY BHA WITH TRI−CONE AND REAMER. TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM.

05:00 06:00 1.0 2273 2273 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETING: TRIPPING PIPE AND WINCH LINE SAFTEY.


FUEL USED 850 GALLONS.

01−19−2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $108,610 Completion $0 Daily Total $108,610

Cum Costs: Drilling $297,969 Completion $0 Well Total $297,969

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 0 0 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.

07:00 11:30 4.5 0 0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

11:30 13:30 2.0 0 0 RIG UP TO RUN CASING.

13:30 18:00 4.5 0 0 RUN 54 JTS (2244.69’) OF 9−5/8", 36.0#, K−55, ST&C CASING WITH HALLIBURTON GUIDE SHOE
AND FLOAT COLLAR. 12 CENTRALIZERS SPACED 10’ FROM THE SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2
AND #3 THEN EVERY 5TH COLLAR TO SURFACE. ALSO 2 CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @
2223.69’ TVD / 2263.69’ MD.

18:00 19:00 1.0 0 0 RUN 200’ OF 1" PIPE.

19:00 20:00 1.0 0 0 RDMO CRAIG’S PRESET RIG. RELEASE RIG @ 20:00 PM ON 01/18/12. MOVING TO CWU 1543−26D.





ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19’


NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.


SAFTEY MEETINGS: TRIPPING PIPE AND RUNNING CASING.


FUEL USED 150 GALLONS.

20:00 06:00 10.0 0 0 CEMENT JOB: MIRU HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED
LINES AND CEMENT VALVE TO 4000 PSIG. PUMPED 30 BBLS FRESH WATER & 20 BBLS GELLED
WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT.





LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (183 BBLS) OF PREMIUM LEAD CEMENT WITH 0.3%
VERSASET, 2% CAL−SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @ 10.5 PPG WITH YIELD
OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT WITH 2%
CACL2 MIXED TAIL CEMENT @ 15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.2 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH
170 BBLS DIRTY WATER. BUMPED PLUG WITH 1000# @ 23:49 PM ON 01/18/12. FLOAT HELD.
SHUT−IN CASING VALVE. BROKE CIRCULATION 130 BBLS INTO LEAD CEMENT, LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE 70 BBLS INTO DISPLACEMENT. CIRCULATED ABOUT 100 BBLS OF LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE. WOC 1 HR 30 MIN.





TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 200’ OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL.





PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER
ACTIVITY.
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

21:30 22:30 1.0 2273 2273 WORK ON WINCH LINE ON RIG.

22:30 01:00 2.5 2273 2273 FINISH TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

01:00 05:00 4.0 2273 2273 TALLY BHA WITH TRI-CONE AND REAMER. TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM.

05:00 06:00 1.0 2273 2273 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.1

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETING: TRIPPING PIPE AND WINCH LINE SAFTEY.1

FUEL USED 850 GALLONS.

01-19-2012 Reported By KYLAN COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $108,610 Completion $0 Daily Total $108,610

Cum Costs: Drilling $297,969 Completion $0 Well Total $297,969

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 0 0 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND RUN CASING.

07:00 11:30 4.5 0 0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

11:30 13:30 2.0 0 0 RIG UP TO RUN CASING.

13:30 18:00 4.5 0 0 RUN 54 JTS (2244.69') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#, K-55, ST&C CASING WITH HALLIBURTON GUIDE SHOE
AND FLOAT COLLAR. 12 CENTRALIZERS SPACED 10'FROM THE SHOE, ON TOP OF JOINTS #2
AND #3 THEN EVERY 5TH COLLAR TO SURFACE. ALSO 2 CENTRALIZERS AT KOP. LANDED @
2223.69' TVD / 2263.69' MD.

18:00 19:00 1.0 0 0 RUN 200' OF 1" PIPE.

19:00 20:00 1.0 0 0 RDMO CRAIG'S PRESET RIG. RELEASE RIG @20:00 PM ON 01/18/12. MOVING TO CWU 1543-26D.

ALL SURVEYS AND DEPTHS ADJUSTED TO TRUE #34 RKB=19'l

NO ACCIDENTS REPORTED.I

SAFTEY MEETINGS: TRIPPING PIPE AND RUNNING CASING.1

FUEL USED 150 GALLONS.

20:00 06:00 10.0 0 0 CEMENT JOB: MIRU HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED
LINES AND CEMENT VALVE TO 4000 PSIG. PUMPED 30 BBLS FRESH WATER & 20 BBLS GELLED
WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT.1

LEAD: MIXED AND PUMPED 250 SACKS (183 BBLS) OF PREMIUM LEAD CEMENT WITH 0.3%
VERSASET, 2% CAL-SEAL, AND 2% ECONOLITE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @10.5 PPG WITH YIELD
OF 4.1 CF/SX. TAIL: MIXED AND PUMPED 300 SACKS (63 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT WITH 2%
CACL2 MIXED TAIL CEMENT @15.6 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.2 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT WITH
170 BBLS DIRTY WATER. BUMPED PLUG WITH 1000# @23:49 PM ON 01/18/12. FLOAT HELD.
SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. BROKE CIRCULATION 130 BBLS INTO LEAD CEMENT, LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE 70 BBLS INTO DISPLACEMENT. CIRCULATED ABOUT 100 BBLS OF LEAD CEMENT
TO SURFACE. WOC 1 HR 30 MIN.1

TOP JOB #1: PUMP DOWN 200' OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 75 SX (15 BBLS) OF PREMIUM
CEMENT WITH 2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @15.8 PPG WITH YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. GOOD
CEMENT TO SURFACE. HOLE STOOD FULL.I

PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER
ACTIVITY.1
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346




KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED BLM VIA E−MAIL OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON
01/17/12 @ 14:45 PM. KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELS WITH UDOGM VIA PHONE OF
THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 01/17/12 @ 14:45 PM.

03−08−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,087 Completion $0 Daily Total $29,087

Cum Costs: Drilling $327,057 Completion $0 Well Total $327,057

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

22:00 00:00 2.0 0 0 RIG DOWN & SKID BACK 10’ TO CWU 1544−26D.

00:00 01:00 1.0 0 0 RIG UP.

01:00 02:00 1.0 0 0 NIPPLE UP BOP.  RIG ACCEPTED FOR DAYWORK @ 01:00 3/8/2012.


02:00 06:00 4.0 0 0 TEST UPPER & LOWER  KELLY VALVES, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE VALVES, CHOKE MANIFOLD,
CHECK VALVE, PIPE RAMS & BLIND RAMS TO 5000 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, ANNULAR 2500 PSI
HIGH, 250 LOW,  CASING 1500 PSI.


 


NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, SKIDDING RIG


FUEL 4144 GALS., USED 336 GALS.


TRANSFER 4480 GALS FROM THE CWU 1541−26D

03−09−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,792 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,792

Cum Costs: Drilling $368,849 Completion $0 Well Total $368,849

MD 3,400 TVD 3,340 Progress 1,117 Days 1 MW 10.5 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 3400’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 0 0 TEST CASING TO 1500#.

06:30 07:00 0.5 0 0 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.

07:00 08:00 1.0 0 0 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS & OREINT MWD.

08:00 10:00 2.0 0 0 PICK UP HWDP & TRIP IN HOLE W/ DRILLPIPE.

10:00 11:00 1.0 0 0 SLIP & CUT 95’ OF DRILLING LINE.

11:00 12:30 1.5 0 0 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP. & 10’ OF NEW HOLE.

12:30 13:00 0.5 2273 2283 F.I.T. TO 145# W/ 10.8 MUD WIEGHT= 12.0# ESTIMATED MUD WIEGHT.

13:00 16:30 3.5 2283 2578 ROTATE & SLIDE 2283’ − 2578’.= 295’, ROP 84.3 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68,  SPP 1325
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 457 GPM. 82% ROTATE, 18% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION TOP
2327’. SPUD @ 13:00 3/8/12.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 06:00 13.0 2578 3400 ROTATE & SLIDE 2578’ TO 3400.= 822’, ROP 63.2 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68,  SPP 1525
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 457 GPM. 62% ROTATE, 38% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED BLM VIA E-MAIL OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON
01/17/12 @14:45 PM. KYLAN COOK NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELS WITH UDOGM VIA PHONE OF
THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 01/17/12 @14:45 PM.

03-08-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,087 Completion $0 Daily Total $29,087

Cum Costs: Drilling $327,057 Completion $0 Well Total $327,057

MD 2,273 TVD 2,233 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

22:00 00:00 2.0 0 0 RIG DOWN & SKID BACK 10' TO CWU 1544-26D.

00:00 01:00 1.0 0 0 RIG UP.

01:00 02:00 1.0 0 0 NIPPLE UP BOP. RIG ACCEPTED FOR DAYWORK @01:00 3/8/2012.1

02:00 06:00 4.0 0 0 TEST UPPER & LOWER KELLY VALVES, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE VALVES, CHOKE MANIFOLD,
CHECK VALVE, PIPE RAMS & BLIND RAMS TO 5000 PSI HIGH, 250 LOW, ANNULAR 2500 PSI
HIGH, 250 LOW, CASING 1500 PSI.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, SKIDDING RIGT

FUEL 4144 GALS., USED 336 GALS.I

TRANSFER 4480 GALS FROM THE CWU 1541-26D

03-09-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,792 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,792

Cum Costs: Drilling $368,849 Completion $0 Well Total $368,849

MD 3,400 TVD 3,340 Progress 1,117 Days 1 MW 10.5 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @3400'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 0 0 TEST CASING TO 1500#.

06:30 07:00 0.5 0 0 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.

07:00 08:00 1.0 0 0 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS & OREINT MWD.

08:00 10:00 2.0 0 0 PICK UP HWDP & TRIP IN HOLE W/ DRILLPIPE.

10:00 11:00 1.0 0 0 SLIP & CUT 95' OF DRILLING LINE.

11:00 12:30 1.5 0 0 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP. & 10' OF NEW HOLE.

12:30 13:00 0.5 2273 2283 F.I.T. TO 145# W/ 10.8 MUD WIEGHT= 12.0# ESTIMATED MUD WIEGHT.

13:00 16:30 3.5 2283 2578 ROTATE & SLIDE 2283' - 2578'.= 295', ROP 84.3 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68, SPP 1325
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 457 GPM. 82% ROTATE, 18% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION TOP
2327'. SPUD @13:00 3/8/12.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 06:00 13.0 2578 3400 ROTATE & SLIDE 2578' TO 3400.= 822', ROP 63.2 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68, SPP 1525
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 457 GPM. 62% ROTATE, 38% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP

2327'.¯

NO INCIDENT NO
ACCIDENT¯
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, PICKING UP BHA, OPERATING FORK LIFT


COM CHECK TRIPPING & DRILLING


BOP DRILL NIGHT CREW


FUEL 2800 GALS., USED 1344 GALS.





06:00 0 0 SPUD 7 7/8’ SURFACE HOLE @ 13:00 HRS ON 3/8/12.

03−10−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $67,082 Completion $0 Daily Total $67,082

Cum Costs: Drilling $435,931 Completion $0 Well Total $435,931

MD 4,820 TVD 4,740 Progress 1,420 Days 2 MW 10.5 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 4820’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:00 10.0 3400 4136 ROTATE & SLIDE 3400’ TO 4136’.= 736’, ROP 73.6 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68,  SPP 1750
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 457 GPM. 82% ROTATE, 18% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327’, WASATCH 4705’.

16:00 16:30 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:30 06:00 13.5 4136 4820 ROTATE & SLIDE 4136’ TO 4820’.= 684’, ROP 50.7 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68,  SPP 2000
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 457 GPM. 83% ROTATE, 17% SLIDE,  MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327’, WASATCH 4705’, CHAPITA WELLS 5298’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, MIXING CHEMICALS, SERVICING RIG


COM CHECK DRILLING


BOP DRILL DAY CREW


FUEL 8624 GALS USED 1676


RECIEVED 7500 GALS OF FUEL

03−11−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $33,429 Completion $0 Daily Total $33,429

Cum Costs: Drilling $469,360 Completion $0 Well Total $469,360

MD 5,666 TVD 5,586 Progress 846 Days 3 MW 10.6 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING  @ 5666’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:30 10.5 4820 5229 ROTATE & SLIDE 4820’ TO 5229’ = 409’, ROP 38.9 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68,  SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 200−400, 457 GPM. 98% ROTATE, 2% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705’, CHAPITA WELLS 5298’,
BUCK CANYON 5917’.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 02:00 9.0 5229 5557 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 5229’ TO 5557’ = 328’, ROP 36.4 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP
2050 PSI, DIFF. 100−350, 450 GPM. 96.5% ROTATE, 3.5% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705’, CHAPITA WELLS
5298’, BUCK CANYON 5917’.  MOVE CLOCK FORWARD FOR DLS.

03:00 06:00 3.0 5557 5666 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 5557’ TO 5666’ = 109’, ROP 36.3 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP
2050 PSI, DIFF. 100−350, 450 GPM. 89.5% ROTATE, 10.5% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705’, CHAPITA WELLS
5298’, BUCK CANYON 5917’.
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, PICKING UP BHA, OPERATING FORK LIFT E

COM CHECK TRIPPING & DRILLINGT

BOP DRILL NIGHT CREWT

FUEL 2800 GALS., USED 1344 GALS.I

06:00 0 0 SPUD 7 7/8' SURFACE HOLE @13:00 HRS ON 3/8/12.

03-10-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $67,082 Completion $0 Daily Total $67,082

Cum Costs: Drilling $435,931 Completion $0 Well Total $435,931

MD 4,820 TVD 4,740 Progress 1,420 Days 2 MW 10.5 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @4820'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:00 10.0 3400 4136 ROTATE & SLIDE 3400' TO 4136'.= 736', ROP 73.6 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68, SPP 1750
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 457 GPM. 82% ROTATE, 18% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327', WASATCH 4705'.

16:00 16:30 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:30 06:00 13.5 4136 4820 ROTATE & SLIDE 4136' TO 4820'.= 684', ROP 50.7 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68, SPP 2000
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 457 GPM. 83% ROTATE, 17% SLIDE, MAHOGANY OIL SHALE FORMATION
TOP 2327', WASATCH 4705', CHAPITA WELLS 5298'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, MIXING CHEMICALS, SERVICING RIGT

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

BOP DRILL DAY CREW T

FUEL 8624 GALS USED 16761

RECIEVED 7500 GALS OF FUEL

03-11-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $33,429 Completion $0 Daily Total $33,429

Cum Costs: Drilling $469,360 Completion $0 Well Total $469,360

MD 5,666 TVD 5,586 Progress 846 Days 3 MW 10.6 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @5666'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:30 10.5 4820 5229 ROTATE & SLIDE 4820' TO 5229' = 409', ROP 38.9 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 68, SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 200-400, 457 GPM. 98% ROTATE, 2% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705', CHAPITA WELLS 5298',
BUCK CANYON 5917'.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 02:00 9.0 5229 5557 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 5229' TO 5557' = 328', ROP 36.4 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP
2050 PSI, DIFF. 100-350, 450 GPM. 96.5% ROTATE, 3.5% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705', CHAPITA WELLS
5298', BUCK CANYON 5917'. MOVE CLOCK FORWARD FOR DLS.

03:00 06:00 3.0 5557 5666 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 5557' TO 5666' = 109', ROP 36.3 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP
2050 PSI, DIFF. 100-350, 450 GPM. 89.5% ROTATE, 10.5% SLIDE, WASATCH 4705', CHAPITA WELLS
5298', BUCK CANYON 5917'.I
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346




NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING, PROPER LIFTING, USING WINCHED


FUEL 6944 GALS, USED 1680 GALS.


LOST 1 HR DUE TO TIME CHANGE.

03−12−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,482 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,482

Cum Costs: Drilling $504,842 Completion $0 Well Total $504,842

MD 6,620 TVD 6,540 Progress 954 Days 4 MW 10.7 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 6620’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 5666 6072 ROTATE & SLIDE 5666’ TO 6072’ = 406’, ROP 42.7 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP 2100
PSI, DIFF. 100−350, 450 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE,CHAPITA WELLS 5298’,  BUCK CANYON
5917’, NORTH HORN 6698’.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 6072 6620 ROTATE & SLIDE 6072’ TO 6620’ = 548’, ROP 39.1 FPH, WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP 2150
PSI, DIFF. 100−350, 446 GPM. 96% ROTATE, 4% SLIDE, BUCK CANYON 5917’, NORTH HORN 6698’,
PRICE RIVER 7025’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, USING PRESSURE WASHER, CLEANING LIGHT PLANT.


COM CHECK DRILLING


FUEL 5152 GALS, USED 1792 GALS.

03−13−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $34,519 Completion $4,370 Daily Total $38,890

Cum Costs: Drilling $539,362 Completion $4,370 Well Total $543,733

MD 7,260 TVD 7,180 Progress 640 Days 5 MW 11.0 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 7260’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:30 10.5 6620 6919 ROTATE & SLIDE 6620’ TO 6919 = 299’, ROP 28.5 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP 2200
PSI, DIFF. 100−350, 446 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE, BUCK CANYON 5917’, NORTH HORN 6698’,
PRICE RIVER 7025’.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 06:00 13.0 6919 7260 ROTATE & SLIDE 6919’ TO 7260’ = 341’, ROP 26.2 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67,  SPP 2200
PSI, DIFF. 80−350, 446 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE, NORTH HORN 6698’, PRICE RIVER 7025’,
PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, UNLOADING CASING, DRIVING TO & FROM WORK.


COM CHECK DRILLING.
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING, PROPER LIFTING, USING WINCHEDI

FUEL 6944 GALS, USED 1680 GALS.I

LOST 1 HR DUE TO TIME CHANGE.

03-12-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,482 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,482

Cum Costs: Drilling $504,842 Completion $0 Well Total $504,842

MD 6,620 TVD 6,540 Progress 954 Days 4 MW 10.7 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @6620'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 5666 6072 ROTATE & SLIDE 5666' TO 6072' = 406', ROP 42.7 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP 2100
PSI, DIFF. 100-350, 450 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE,CHAPITA WELLS 5298', BUCK CANYON
5917', NORTH HORN 6698'.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 6072 6620 ROTATE & SLIDE 6072' TO 6620' = 548', ROP 39.1 FPH, WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP 2150
PSI, DIFF. 100-350, 446 GPM. 96% ROTATE, 4% SLIDE, BUCK CANYON 5917', NORTH HORN 6698',
PRICE RIVER 7025'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, USING PRESSURE WASHER, CLEANING LIGHT PLANT.1

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

FUEL 5152 GALS, USED 1792 GALS.

03-13-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $34,519 Completion $4,370 Daily Total $38,890

Cum Costs: Drilling $539,362 Completion $4,370 Well Total $543,733

MD 7,260 TVD 7,180 Progress 640 Days 5 MW 11.0 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @7260'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 16:30 10.5 6620 6919 ROTATE & SLIDE 6620' TO 6919 = 299', ROP 28.5 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP 2200
PSI, DIFF. 100-350, 446 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE, BUCK CANYON 5917', NORTH HORN 6698',
PRICE RIVER 7025'.

16:30 17:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

17:00 06:00 13.0 6919 7260 ROTATE & SLIDE 6919' TO 7260' = 341', ROP 26.2 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 67, SPP 2200
PSI, DIFF. 80-350, 446 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE, NORTH HORN 6698', PRICE RIVER 7025',
PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, UNLOADING CASING, DRIVING TO & FROM WORK.1

COM CHECK DRILLING.1
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

FUEL 3420 GALS., USED 1732 GALS.

03−14−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $70,569 Completion $0 Daily Total $70,569

Cum Costs: Drilling $609,932 Completion $4,370 Well Total $614,303

MD 8,015 TVD 7,935 Progress 755 Days 6 MW 11.1 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 8015’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 7260 7581 ROTATE & SLIDE 7260’ TO 7581’ = 321’, ROP 33.8 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 66,  SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 80−350, 442 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 7025’,  PRICE RIVER MIDDLE
7900’.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 7581 8015 ROTATE & SLIDE 7581’ TO 8015 = 434’, ROP 31 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 55/65, MM 64,  SPP 2150 PSI,
DIFF. 80−350, 428 GPM. 97.5% ROTATE, 2.5% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 7025’,  PRICE RIVER MIDDLE
7900’, PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING


SAFETY MEETING, LAST DAY AWARENESS, LOCK OUT TAG OUT.


RECIEVED 7200 GALS FUEL


FUEL 8736 GALS, USED 1884 GALS.

03−15−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $55,759 Completion $2,135 Daily Total $57,895

Cum Costs: Drilling $665,692 Completion $6,506 Well Total $672,198

MD 8,682 TVD 8,602 Progress 667 Days 7 MW 11.4 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 8015 8392 ROTATE & SLIDE 8015’ TO 8392’ = 377’, ROP 41.9 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/65, MM 64,  SPP 2250
PSI, DIFF. 80−350, 428 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE,  PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900’, PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691’.

15:00 15:30 0.5 0 0 RIG SERVICE.

15:30 04:30 13.0 8392 8682 ROTATE & SLIDE 8392’ TO 8682’ = 290’, ROP 22.3 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 40/65, MM 64,  SPP 2250
PSI, DIFF. 80−350, 428 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE,  PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900’, PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691’, SEGO 9212’.

04:30 05:00 0.5 0 0 CIRCULATE & BUILD SLUG TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT#3.

05:00 06:00 1.0 0 0 PUMP DRY JOB, BLOW DOWN KELLY & TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #3.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPING


SAFETY MEETING, MIXING CHEMICALS,LOCK OUT TAG OUT


FUEL 6954 GALS., USED 1782 GALS

03−16−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

FUEL 3420 GALS., USED 1732 GALS.

03-14-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $70,569 Completion $0 Daily Total $70,569

Cum Costs: Drilling $609,932 Completion $4,370 Well Total $614,303

MD 8,015 TVD 7,935 Progress 755 Days 6 MW 11.1 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @8015'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 7260 7581 ROTATE & SLIDE 7260' TO 7581' = 321', ROP 33.8 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 66, SPP 2050
PSI, DIFF. 80-350, 442 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 7025', PRICE RIVER MIDDLE
7900'.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 06:00 14.0 7581 8015 ROTATE & SLIDE 7581' TO 8015 = 434', ROP 31 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 55/65, MM 64, SPP 2150 PSI,
DIFF. 80-350, 428 GPM. 97.5% ROTATE, 2.5% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER 7025', PRICE RIVER MIDDLE
7900', PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLINGT

SAFETY MEETING, LAST DAY AWARENESS, LOCK OUT TAG OUT.1

RECIEVED 7200 GALS FUELL

FUEL 8736 GALS, USED 1884 GALS.

03-15-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $55,759 Completion $2,135 Daily Total $57,895

Cum Costs: Drilling $665,692 Completion $6,506 Well Total $672,198

MD 8,682 TVD 8,602 Progress 667 Days 7 MW 11.4 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 8015 8392 ROTATE & SLIDE 8015' TO 8392' = 377', ROP 41.9 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/65, MM 64, SPP 2250
PSI, DIFF. 80-350, 428 GPM. 97% ROTATE, 3% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900', PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691'.

15:00 15:30 0.5 0 0 RIG SERVICE.

15:30 04:30 13.0 8392 8682 ROTATE & SLIDE 8392' TO 8682' = 290', ROP 22.3 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 40/65, MM 64, SPP 2250
PSI, DIFF. 80-350, 428 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900', PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691', SEGO 9212'.

04:30 05:00 0.5 0 0 CIRCULATE & BUILD SLUG TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT#3.

05:00 06:00 1.0 0 0 PUMP DRY JOB, BLOW DOWN KELLY & TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #3.1

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPINGT

SAFETY MEETING, MIXING CHEMICALS,LOCK OUT TAG OUTE

FUEL 6954 GALS., USED 1782 GALS

03-16-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,147 Completion $268 Daily Total $35,415

Cum Costs: Drilling $700,840 Completion $6,774 Well Total $707,614

MD 9,105 TVD 9,025 Progress 423 Days 8 MW 11.5 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 9105’

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 0 0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE W/ BIT #3, (WORK TIGHT HOLE FROM 4600’ TO 4860’)

10:00 11:30 1.5 0 0 LAY DOWN BIT & MUD MOTOR, & MWD & REPROGRAM MWD.(FUNCTION BLIND RAMS)

11:30 17:00 5.5 0 0 PICK UP FRESH MUD MOTOR & BIT, SCRIBE MWD & TRIP IN HOLE (WASH THROUGH BRIDGES
@ 6840’, 7350’ & WASH 30’ TO BOTTOM.

17:00 18:30 1.5 8682 8737 ROTATE & SLIDE 8682’ TO 8737’  = 55’, ROP 36.7 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62,  SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 100−250, 411 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE,  PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900’, PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691’, SEGO 9212’.

18:30 19:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

19:00 06:00 11.0 8737 9105 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 8737’ TO 9105’  = 368’, ROP 33.5 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62,  SPP
2400 PSI, DIFF. 100−250, 412 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691’, SEGO
9212’.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPING


SAFETY MEETING, MAKING CONNECTIONS, TRIPPING PIPE


FUEL 5700 GALS, USED 1254 GALS.

03−17−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $38,252 Completion $0 Daily Total $38,252

Cum Costs: Drilling $739,092 Completion $6,774 Well Total $745,867

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 286 Days 9 MW 12.0 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO LD DP

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 9105 9391 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 9105’ TO 9391’ = 286’, ROP 30.1 FPH,WOB 15−25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62,  SPP
2375 PSI, DIFF. 100−250, 411 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691’, SEGO
9212’. TD @ 9391’ @ 16:00 3/16/2012.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 18:30 2.5 0 0 CIRCULATE @ TD (9391’) FOR WIPER TRIP.

18:30 22:00 3.5 0 0 PUMP DRY JOB & TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR WIPER TRIP.

22:00 23:00 1.0 0 0 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

23:00 03:30 4.5 0 0 MAKE UP BIT SUB & BIT & TRIP IN HOLE. FILL PIPE @ 2300’, 5173’, & 8380’.

03:30 04:00 0.5 0 0 WASH & REAM 50’ TO BOTTOM, 10’ OF FILL. 

04:00 06:00 2.0 0 0 CIRCULATE & CODITION HOLE TO LAY DOWN DRILLPIPE. 15−20’ FLARE FOR 20 MIN. W/
BOTTOMS UP.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING, WORK PLACE SAFETY, TRIPPING & LAYING DOWN TOOLS


COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPING


Page 11

Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,147 Completion $268 Daily Total $35,415

Cum Costs: Drilling $700,840 Completion $6,774 Well Total $707,614

MD 9,105 TVD 9,025 Progress 423 Days 8 MW 11.5 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @9105'

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 0 0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE W/ BIT #3, (WORK TIGHT HOLE FROM 4600' TO 4860')

10:00 11:30 1.5 0 0 LAY DOWN BIT & MUD MOTOR, & MWD & REPROGRAM MWD.(FUNCTION BLIND RAMS)

11:30 17:00 5.5 0 0 PICK UP FRESH MUD MOTOR & BIT, SCRIBE MWD & TRIP IN HOLE (WASH THROUGH BRIDGES

@6840', 7350' & WASH 30' TO BOTTOM.

17:00 18:30 1.5 8682 8737 ROTATE & SLIDE 8682' TO 8737' = 55', ROP 36.7 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62, SPP 2350
PSI, DIFF. 100-250, 411 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER MIDDLE 7900', PRICE RIVER
LOWER 8691', SEGO 9212'.

18:30 19:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

19:00 06:00 11.0 8737 9105 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 8737' TO 9105' = 368', ROP 33.5 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62, SPP
2400 PSI, DIFF. 100-250, 412 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691', SEGO
9212'.I

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPINGT

SAFETY MEETING, MAKING CONNECTIONS, TRIPPING PIPE I

FUEL 5700 GALS, USED 1254 GALS.

03-17-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $38,252 Completion $0 Daily Total $38,252

Cum Costs: Drilling $739,092 Completion $6,774 Well Total $745,867

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 286 Days 9 MW 12.0 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO LD DP

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 9105 9391 ROTATE & SLIDE TO 9105' TO 9391' = 286', ROP 30.1 FPH,WOB 15-25K, RPM 50/65, MM 62, SPP
2375 PSI, DIFF. 100-250, 411 GPM. 100% ROTATE, 0% SLIDE, PRICE RIVER LOWER 8691', SEGO
9212'. TD @9391' @16:00 3/16/2012.

15:30 16:00 0.5 0 0 SERVICE RIG.

16:00 18:30 2.5 0 0 CIRCULATE @TD (9391') FOR WIPER TRIP.

18:30 22:00 3.5 0 0 PUMP DRY JOB & TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR WIPER TRIP.

22:00 23:00 1.0 0 0 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

23:00 03:30 4.5 0 0 MAKE UP BIT SUB & BIT & TRIP IN HOLE. FILL PIPE @2300', 5173', & 8380'.

03:30 04:00 0.5 0 0 WASH & REAM 50' TO BOTTOM, 10' OF FILL.

04:00 06:00 2.0 0 0 CIRCULATE & CODITION HOLE TO LAY DOWN DRILLPIPE. 15-20'FLARE FOR 20 MIN. W/
BOTTOMS UP.1

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING, WORK PLACE SAFETY, TRIPPING & LAYING DOWN TOOLSI

COM CHECK DRILLING & TRIPPINGT
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

FUEL 3990 GALS, USED 1910 GALS.

03−18−2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $43,138 Completion $167,773 Daily Total $210,912

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $174,548 Well Total $956,779

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 12.0 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 11:30 5.5 0 0 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE & TRIP OUT, STAND BACK 11 STANDS OF DRILL PIPE, HWDP & DRILL
COLLARS.

11:30 12:00 0.5 0 0 PULL WEAR BUSHING.





12:00 19:30 7.5 0 0 RUN TOTAL OF 209 JTS OF CASING ( 207 FULL JTS  OF 4.5", 11.6#, N−80, LT&C + 2 MARKER
JOINTS 11.6#, P−110, LT&C) AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, 51 JTS OF
CASING, MARKER JOINT, @ TOP OF PRICE RIVER, 60 JTS, CASING, MARKER JOINT, @ 400’
ABOVE WASATCH, 95 JTS CASING. RAN 3 TURBILIZERS (5’ ABOVE SHOE AND MIDDLE OF JTS
#2 & #3) + 1 BOW CENTRALIZER EVERY 3RD JOINT THEREAFTER TO 400’ ABOVE WASATCH
(TOTAL OF 40) TAG BOTTOM , LAY DOWN TAG JOINT, PICK UP MANDREL & LAND CASING W/
82K STRING WEIGHT @ 9380’. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM W/ NO HOLE PROBLEMS.





CASING LANDED AS FOLLOWS (DEPTHS SHOWN ARE TOPS OF 


COMPONENTS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED):


FLOAT SHOE (BOTTOM): 9380’


FLOAT COLLAR: 9333’


MARKER JOINT: 7007’


MARKER JOINT: 4288’





19:30 23:00 3.5 0 0 CIRCULATE CASING ON BOTTOM, LAST 200 BBLS W/ 0.5 GPT ALDICIDE. 10−15’ FLARE FOR 20
MIN.

23:00 01:30 2.5 0 0 TEST LINE TO 7000#, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH WATER
W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 515 SKS (148 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61 YIELD W/ 4% BENTONITE, 0.3%
VERSASET, 0.5% HR−5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1345 SKS (352 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47 YIELD W/ 0.125
LBM POLY−E−FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 147 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5 GPT
MYACIDE, DISPLACED @ 8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 3 BBLS MIN W/ 137BBLS GONE, FCP 2320#,
BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3330#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT,  FLOATS HELD. FULL
RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB.

01:30 02:30 1.0 0 0 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# & HOLD ON CASING FOR 1 HR.

02:30 03:30 1.0 0 0 REMOVE CEMENT HEAD & LANDING JOINT, INSTALL PACKOFF & TEST TO 5000 PSI.

03:30 04:30 1.0 0 0 RIG DOWN TO MOVE TO CWU 1543−26D.

04:30 06:00 1.5 0 0 NIPPLE DOWN BOP.





NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENT


FULL CREWS


SAFETY MEETING LAYING DOWN DRILLPIPE, RUNNING CASING


FUEL 3420 GALS, USED 570 GALS


TRANSFERED 3420 GALS FUEL TO CWU 1543−26D





06:00 0 0 RIG RELEASED @ 06:00 HRS, 3−18−2012.


CASING POINT COST $782,232
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

FUEL 3990 GALS, USED 1910 GALS.

03-18-2012 Reported By JOHNNY TURNER

DailyCosts: Drilling $43,138 Completion $167,773 Daily Total $210,912

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $174,548 Well Total $956,779

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 12.0 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 11:30 5.5 0 0 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE & TRIP OUT, STAND BACK 11 STANDS OF DRILL PIPE, HWDP & DRILL
COLLARS.

11:30 12:00 0.5 0 0 PULL WEAR BUSHING. I

12:00 19:30 7.5 0 0 RUN TOTAL OF 209 JTS OF CASING ( 207 FULL JTS OF 4.5", 11.6#, N-80, LT&C + 2 MARKER
JOINTS 11.6#, P-110, LT&C) AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, 51 JTS OF
CASING, MARKER JOINT, @TOP OF PRICE RIVER, 60 JTS, CASING, MARKER JOINT, @400'
ABOVE WASATCH, 95 JTS CASING. RAN 3 TURBILIZERS (5'ABOVE SHOE AND MIDDLE OF JTS
#2 & #3) + 1 BOW CENTRALIZER EVERY 3RD JOINT THEREAFTER TO 400'ABOVE WASATCH
(TOTAL OF 40) TAG BOTTOM , LAY DOWN TAG JOINT, PICK UP MANDREL & LAND CASING W/
82K STRING WEIGHT @9380'. CASING WENT TO BOTTOM W/ NO HOLE PROBLEMS.I

CASING LANDED AS FOLLOWS (DEPTHS SHOWN ARE TOPS OF I

COMPONENTS UNLESS OTHERWISE STATED):I

FLOAT SHOE (BOTTOM): 9380'l

FLOAT COLLAR: 9333'l

MARKER JOINT: 7007'l

MARKER JOINT: 4288'l

19:30 23:00 3.5 0 0 CIRCULATE CASING ON BOTTOM, LAST 200 BBLS W/ 0.5 GPT ALDICIDE. 10-15'FLARE FOR 20
MIN.

23:00 01:30 2.5 0 0 TEST LINE TO 7000#, PUMP 20BBLS OF CHEMICAL FLUSH W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, 10 FRESH WATER
W/ 0.5 GPT XCIDE, PUMP 515 SKS (148 BBLS) OF 12.5#, 1.61YIELD W/ 4% BENTONITE, 0.3%
VERSASET, 0.5% HR-5 OF LEAD CEMENT, 1345 SKS (352 BBLS) OF 13.5#, 1.47YIELD W/ 0.125
LBM POLY-E-FLAKE OF TAIL CEMENT, DISPLACED W/ 147 BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ .5 GPT
MYACIDE, DISPLACED @8 BBLS MIN., SLOWED TO 3 BBLS MIN W/ 137BBLS GONE, FCP 2320#,
BUMPED PLUG & PRESSURED UP TO 3330#, BLEED OFF & CHECK FLOAT, FLOATS HELD. FULL
RETURNS THROUGH OUT JOB.

01:30 02:30 1.0 0 0 PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1000# & HOLD ON CASING FOR 1 HR.

02:30 03:30 1.0 0 0 REMOVE CEMENT HEAD & LANDING JOINT, INSTALL PACKOFF & TEST TO 5000 PSI.

03:30 04:30 1.0 0 0 RIG DOWN TO MOVE TO CWU 1543-26D.

04:30 06:00 1.5 0 0 NIPPLE DOWN BOP.1

NO INCIDENT NO ACCIDENTI

FULL CREWS T

SAFETY MEETING LAYING DOWN DRILLPIPE, RUNNING CA SINGT

FUEL 3420 GALS, USED 570 GALSI

TRANSFERED 3420 GALS FUEL TO CWU 1543-26DI

06:00 0 0 RIG RELEASED @06:00 HRS, 3-18-2012.1

CASING POINT COST $782,232
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

04−12−2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $16,000 Daily Total $16,000

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,548 Well Total $972,779

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. LOG WITH CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FORM 9317’ TO 70’. EST CEMENT TOP
@ 1100’. RDWL.

05−12−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $205 Daily Total $205

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,753 Well Total $972,984

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8839’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 FRAC TANKS PRE MIXED W/BIOCIDE (BE 6) @ 3# PER TANK.





STAGE 1. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE & MIRU HALLIBURTON, PERFORATE LPR FROM 9066’−67’,
9055’−56’, 8992’−93’, 8965’−66’, 8942’−43’, 8911’−12’, 8888’−89’, 8875’−76’, 8865’−66’, 8857’−58’,
8846’−47’, 8839’−40’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL
OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO
6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON
KW31 @ 2GPT), 592 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7440 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5
PPG, 23775 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/ 80300# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5704 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM.
ATP 4415 PSIG. ATR 48 BPM. ISIP 2694 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN. 

05−13−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $205 Daily Total $205

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,958 Well Total $973,189

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8436’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 STAGE 2. SICP 2106 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8820’. PERFORATE MPR/LPR FROM 8802’−03,
8791’−92’, 8785’−86’, 8774’−75’, 8752’−53’, 8740’−41’, 8696’−97’, 8686’−87’, 8674’−75’, 8653’−54’,
8645’−46’, 8636’−37’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31
@ 2GPT). 803 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7433 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG,
35052 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/120300# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5506 PSIG. MTR 50.5 BPM. ATP
4129 PSIG. ATR 49.6 BPM. ISIP 3255 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

04-12-2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $16,000 Daily Total $16,000

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,548 Well Total $972,779

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. LOG WITH CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FORM 9317' TO 70'. EST CEMENT TOP

@1100'. RDWL.

05-12-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $205 Daily Total $205

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,753 Well Total $972,984

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8839'-906T PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 FRAC TANKS PRE MIXED W/BIOCIDE (BE 6) @3# PER TANK.

STAGE 1. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE & MIRU HALLIBURTON, PERFORATE LPR FROM 9066'-67',
9055'-56', 8992'-93', 8965'-66', 8942'-43', 8911'-12', 8888'-89', 8875'-76', 8865'-66', 8857'-58',
8846'-47', 8839'-40' @3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL
OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO
6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON
KW31 @2GPT), 592 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7440 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5

PPG, 23775 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/ 80300# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5704 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM.
ATP 4415 PSIG. ATR 48 BPM. ISIP 2694 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05-13-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $205 Daily Total $205

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $190,958 Well Total $973,189

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 8436'-9067' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 STAGE 2. SICP 2106 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8820'. PERFORATE MPR/LPR FROM 8802'-03,
8791'-92', 8785'-86', 8774'-75', 8752'-53', 8740'-41', 8696'-97', 8686'-87', 8674'-75', 8653'-54',
8645'-46', 8636'-37' @3 SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31

@2GPT). 803 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7433 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG,
35052 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/120300# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5506 PSIG. MTR 50.5 BPM. ATP
4129 PSIG. ATR 49.6 BPM. ISIP 3255 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

STAGE 3. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8612’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8588’−89’, 8576’−77’, 8567’−68’,
8553’−54’, 8541’−42’, 8526’−27, 8520’−21’, 8502’−03, 8475’−76’, 8463’−64’, 8444’−45’, 8436’−37’ @ 3
SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE
INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106 PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH
WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 718 GAL 16#
LINEAR PAD,  7430 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 35491 GAL 16# DELTA 200
W/122300# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5884 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP 4424 PSIG. ATR 49.3 BPM.
ISIP 3085 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05−14−2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $376,787 Daily Total $376,787

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $567,745 Well Total $1,349,977

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU CLEAN OUT SAND AND DRILL OUT FRAC PLUGS.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 0 0 STAGE 4. INTIAL PRESSURE 1856 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8422’. PERFORATE MPR FROM
8401’−02’, 8391’−92’, 8362’−63’, 8353’−54’, 8339’−40’, 8328’−29’, 8314’−15’, 8301’−02’, 8291’−92’,
8276’−77’, 8265’−66’, 8250’−51’@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD
PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55
GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL
BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 750 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7412 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500#
20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 44403 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/153800# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5563
PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 3857 PSIG. ATR 50 BPM. ISIP 3232 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 5. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8212’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8191’−92’, 8181’−82’, 8166’−67’,
8156’−57’, 8143’−44’, 8128’−29’, 8117’−18’, 8096’−97’, 8081’−82’, 8072’−73’, 8058’−59’, 8038’−39’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 951
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7394 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 53724 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/186900# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 4924 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 3541 PSIG. ATR
50 BPM. ISIP 2488 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 6. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8014’. PERFORATE UPR/MPR FROM 7994’−95’, 7966’−67’,
7953’−54’, 7909’−10’, (7903’−04’MISFIRED), 7891’−92’, 7880’−81’, 7868’−69’, 7849’−50’, 7840’−41’,
7820’−21’, 7795’−96’@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106,
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31
@ 2GPT), 1021 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7427 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG,
31262 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/107100# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5665 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP
4010 PSIG. ATR 49.5 BPM. ISIP 2497 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 7. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7770’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7748’−49’, 7736’−37’, 7721’−22’,
7715’−16’, 7699’−7700’, 7645’−46’, 7616’−17’, 7594’−95’, 7585’−86’, 7574’−75’, 7525’−26’, 7513’−14’@
3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 740
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7425 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 32205 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/110000# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5414 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 3924 PSIG. ATR
49.9 BPM. ISIP 2670 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

STAGE 3. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8612'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8588'-89', 8576'-77', 8567'-68',
8553'-54', 8541'-42', 8526'-27, 8520'-21', 8502'-03, 8475'-76', 8463'-64', 8444'-45', 8436'-37' @3
SPF & 120 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD. PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE
INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. PUMP 110 GAL OF NALCO 6106 PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH
WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 718 GAL 16#
LINEAR PAD, 7430 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 35491 GAL 16# DELTA 200
W/122300# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5884 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP 4424 PSIG. ATR 49.3 BPM.
ISIP 3085 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05-14-2012 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $376,787 Daily Total $376,787

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $567,745 Well Total $1,349,977

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050'-906T PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU CLEAN OUT SAND AND DRILL OUT FRAC PLUGS.

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 0 0 STAGE 4. INTIAL PRESSURE 1856 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8422'. PERFORATE MPR FROM
8401'-02', 8391'-92', 8362'-63', 8353'-54', 8339'-40', 8328'-29', 8314'-15', 8301'-02', 8291'-92',
8276'-77', 8265'-66', 8250'-51'@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD
PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55
GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL
BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 750 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7412 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500#
20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 44403 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/153800# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5563
PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 3857 PSIG. ATR 50 BPM. ISIP 3232 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 5. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8212'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8191'-92', 8181'-82', 8166'-67',
8156'-57', 8143'-44', 8128'-29', 8117'-18', 8096'-97', 8081'-82', 8072'-73', 8058'-59', 8038'-39'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 951
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7394 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 53724 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/186900# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 4924 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 3541 PSIG. ATR
50 BPM. ISIP 2488 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 6. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8014'. PERFORATE UPR/MPR FROM 7994'-95', 7966'-67',
7953'-54', 7909'-10', (7903'-04'MISFIRED), 7891'-92', 7880'-81', 7868'-69', 7849'-50', 7840'-41',
7820'-21', 7795'-96'@ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE PUMP 165 GAL OF
NALCO EC 6707 SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106,
PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31

@2GPT), 1021 GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7427 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG,
31262 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/107100# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5665 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP
4010 PSIG. ATR 49.5 BPM. ISIP 2497 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 7. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7770'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7748'-49', 7736'-37', 7721'-22',
7715'-16', 7699'-7700', 7645'-46', 7616'-17', 7594'-95', 7585'-86', 7574'-75', 7525'-26', 7513'-14'@
3 SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 740
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7425 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 32205 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/110000# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5414 PSIG. MTR 50.4 BPM. ATP 3924 PSIG. ATR
49.9 BPM. ISIP 2670 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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RECEIVED: May. 23,



RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

12:00 06:00 18.0 0 0 STAGE 8. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7478’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7456’−57’, 7446’−47’, 7435’−36’,
7418’−19’, 7407’−08’, 7393’−94’, 7382’−83’, 7357’−58’, 7348’−49’, 7338’−39’, 7321’−22’, 7292’−93’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 983
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7469 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 27988 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/95600# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5930 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4361 PSIG. ATR
47.2 BPM. ISIP 2222 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE 9. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7252’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7230’−31’, 7220’−21’, 7210’−11’,
7202’−03’, 7183’−84’, 7131’−32’, 7116’−17’, 7093’−94’, 7084’−85, 7076’−77’, 7064’−65’, 7050’−51’@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL.  RU WIDE SPREAD  PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER.  FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @ 2GPT), 372
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD,  7446 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 36218 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/124500# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 4545 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 3455 PSIG. ATR
48.1 BPM. ISIP 1881 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 7000’. BLED WELL TO 0 PSIG. RDMO CUTTERS WIRELINE &
HALIBURTON SERVICES. SWIFN.

05−18−2012 Reported By BAUSCH / BASTAIN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $58,712 Daily Total $58,712

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $626,457 Well Total $1,408,689

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POST FRAC CLEAN OUT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

18:00 06:00 12.0 0 0 MIRUSU. SICP 0 PSIG. ND FRAC VALVES. NU BOPE. PRESSURE TEST BOP & FLOWLINES TO 2000
PSIG. RIH W/POBS TO CBP @ 7000’. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @ 7000’, 7252’, 7478’,
7770’, 8014’, 8212’ & 8422’. 

05−19−2012 Reported By BAUSCH / BASTAIN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $21,275 Daily Total $21,275

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $647,732 Well Total $1,429,964

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 DRILLED OUT PLUGS @ 8612’ & 8820’. CLEANED OUT TO PBTD @ 9130’. LANDED TBG AT 7716’
KB.  ND BOPE. NU TREE. PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB. RDMOSU.





TUBING DETAIL 				LENGTH





PUMP OFF SUB				1.00’


1 JT 2−3/8 4.7# L−80 TBG			32.67’


XN NIPPLE				1.30’ @ 7681’


235 JTS 2−3/8 4.7# L−80 TBG			7662.22’


BELOW KB				19.00’	


LANDED @				7716.19’ KB
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

12:00 06:00 18.0 0 0 STAGE 8. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7478'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7456'-57', 7446'-47', 7435'-36',
7418'-19', 7407'-08', 7393'-94', 7382'-83', 7357'-58', 7348'-49', 7338'-39', 7321'-22', 7292'-93'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 983
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7469 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 27988 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/95600# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5930 PSIG. MTR 50.3 BPM. ATP 4361 PSIG. ATR
47.2 BPM. ISIP 2222 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

STAGE 9. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7252'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7230'-31', 7220'-21', 7210'-11',
7202'-03', 7183'-84', 7131'-32', 7116'-17', 7093'-94', 7084'-85, 7076'-77', 7064'-65', 7050'-51'@ 3
SPF & 120 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU WIDE SPREAD PUMP 165 GAL OF NALCO EC 6707
SCALE INHIBITOR PLUS 5 BBLS FRESH WATER . PUMP 55 GAL OF NALCO 6106, PLUS 5 BBLS
FRESH WATER. FRAC LPR DOWN CASING W/15 GAL BIOCIDE (BACKTRON KW31 @2GPT), 372
GAL 16# LINEAR PAD, 7446 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 36218 GAL 16#
DELTA 200 W/124500# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 4545 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 3455 PSIG. ATR
48.1 BPM. ISIP 1881 PSIG. RD

HALLIBURTON.¯

RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 7000'. BLED WELL TO 0 PSIG. RDMO CUTTERS WIRELINE &
HALIBURTON SERVICES. SWIFN.

05-18-2012 Reported By BAUSCH / BASTAIN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $58,712 Daily Total $58,712

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $626,457 Well Total $1,408,689

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050'-906T PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POST FRAC CLEAN OUT

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

18:00 06:00 12.0 0 0 MIRUSU. SICP 0 PSIG. ND FRAC VALVES. NU BOPE. PRESSURE TEST BOP & FLOWLINES TO 2000
PSIG. RIH W/POBS TO CBP @7000'. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @7000', 7252', 7478',
7770', 8014', 8212' & 8422'.

05-19-2012 Reported By BAUSCH / BASTAIN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $21,275 Daily Total $21,275

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $647,732 Well Total $1,429,964

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050'-906T PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 0 0 DRILLED OUT PLUGS @8612' & 8820'. CLEANED OUT TO PBTD @9130'. LANDED TBGAT 7716'
KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB. RDMOSU.1

TUBINGDETAIL ]ILENGTHE

PUMP OFF SUB .00'l

1 JT 2-3/8 4.7# L-80 TBG]32.67'l

XN NIPPLE .30' @7681'l

235 JTS 2-3/8 4.7# L-80 TBG]7662.22'l

BELOW KB Il9.00'

LANDED @ 17716.19' KB
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RECEIVED: May. 23, 2012

Well Name: CWU 1544−26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

05−22−2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $1,750 Daily Total $1,750

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $649,482 Well Total $1,431,714

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST/INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 RU TEST UNIT. FLOWED THROUGH TES UNIT 14 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1850 PSIG, CP 2600
PSIG. 21 BPH, RECOVERED 308 BLW. 10347 BLWTR. 1762 MCFD RATE.





INITIAL PRODUCTION:  TURNED WELL TO QUESTAR SALES AT 11:50 AM, 5/21/12.  FLOWING
1380 MCFD ON 18/64" CK.  FTP 1800 PSIG & FCP 2800 PSIG.

05−23−2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $1,750 Daily Total $1,750

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $651,232 Well Total $1,433,464

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050’−9067’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 FLOWED THROUGH TES UNIT 14 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1750 PSIG, CP 2450 PSIG. 18 BPH,
RECOVERED 424 BLW. 9923 BLWTR. 1749 MCFD RATE.
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Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000Sundry Number: 25984 API Well Number: 43047517310000
Well Name: CWU 1544-26D Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066346

05-22-2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $1,750 Daily Total $1,750

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $649,482 Well Total $1,431,714

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050'-906T PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST/INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 RU TEST UNIT. FLOWED THROUGH TES UNIT 14 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1850 PSIG, CP 2600
PSIG. 21 BPH, RECOVERED 308 BLW. 10347 BLWTR. 1762 MCFD RATE.

INITIAL PRODUCTION: TURNED WELL TO QUESTAR SALES AT ll:50 AM, 5/21/12. FLOWING
1380 MCFD ON 18/64" CK. FTP 1800 PSIG & FCP 2800 PSIG.

05-23-2012 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $1,750 Daily Total $1,750

Cum Costs: Drilling $782,231 Completion $651,232 Well Total $1,433,464

MD 9,391 TVD 9,310 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9318.0 Perf : 7050'-906T PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs From To Activity Description

06:00 0 0 FLOWED THROUGH TES UNIT 14 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1750 PSIG, CP 2450 PSIG. 18 BPH,
RECOVERED 424 BLW. 9923 BLWTR. 1749 MCFD RATE.
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Form 3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 2007) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: July31, 2010

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. LeaseSerialNo.
UTUO285A

la. Type of Well O Oil Well Gas Well O Dry O Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion New Well O Work Over O Deepen O Plug Back O Diff. Resvr.
Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

CHAPITAWELLS
2. Name of Operator Contact: MICKENZIEGATES 8. Lease Name and Well .

EOG RESOURCES, INC. E-Mail: MICKENZIE_GATES@EOGRESOURCES.COM CWU 1544-26D
3. Address 600 17TH SREET SUITE 1000N 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. API Well No.

DENVER, CO 80202 Ph: 435-781-9145 43-047-51731
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)* 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

NATURAL BUTTES
At surface NENE 447FNL 501FEL 40.013011 N Lat, 109.399544 W Lon 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and Survey
At top prod interval t orted below ENE 447FNL 501FEL 40.013011 N Lat, 109.399544 W Lon or Area Sec 26 T9S R22E Mer SLB

ep(k\
12. County or Parish 13. State

At total depth NENE449FNL EL 40.013011 N Lat, 109.399544 W Lon UINTAH UT
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completedt 17. Elevations (DF, KB, RT, GL)*

12/18/2011 03/16/2012 OD & A Ready to Prod. 5015 GL
05/21/2012

18. Total Depth: MD 9391 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 9318 20. Dei th Bridge Plug Set: MD
TVD 9311 TVD ig9259 TVD

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Was well cored? No O Yes (Submit analysis)
CBL/CCLIVDL/GR Was DST run? No O Yes (submitanalysis)

Directional Survey? No Yes (Submit analysis)
23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Top Bottom Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry Vol.Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) (MD) (MD) Depth Type of Cement (BBL)
Cement Top* Amount Pulled

12.250 9.625 K-55 36.0 2264 625 0
7.875 4.500 N-80 11.6 9380 1860 1100

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)
2.375 7716

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A) MESAVERDE 7050 9067 8839TO9067 36 OPEN
B) 8636TO8803 36 OPEN
C) 8436 TO 8589 36 OPEN
D) 8250 TO 8402 36 OPEN
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
8839 TO 9067 774 BARRELS OF GELLED WATER &89,900#20/40 SAND RECEIVED

8250 TO 8402 1,267 BARRELS OF GELLED WATER & 163,300#20/40 SAND

28. Production - Interval A DIV.0FOILGAS&MINING
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

05/21/2012 06/04/2012 24 30.0 1342.0 104.0 FLOWS FROM WELL
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. 1100 Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

20/64 SI 1650.0 30 1342 104 PGW
28a. Production - Interval B

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

(See Instructions and spaces foradditional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #141934 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED



28b. Production - Interval C
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production - Interval D
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Product on BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

29. Disposition of Gas(Sold, used forfuel,vented, etc.)
SOLD

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name

Meas. Depth
MESAVERDE 7050 9067 GREEN RIVER 1406

BIRDS NEST 1721
MAHOGANY 2316
UTELANDBUTTE 4579
WASATCH 4700
CHAPITAWELLS 5301
BUCK CANYON 5992
PRICE RIVER 7009

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):
Please see the attached.

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 6. Core Analysis 7 Other:

34. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions):
Electronic Submission #141934 Verified by the BLM Well Information System.

For EOG RESOURCES, INC., sent to the Vernal

Name reea AT Title RE2GULOA12ORYASSISTANT

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency
of the United States any false, fictitious or fradulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



CHAPITA I/VELLSUNIT1544-26D- ADDITIONALREMARKS :

26. PERFORATION RECORD
8038-8192 36 OPEN
7795-7995 33 OPEN
7513-7749 36 OPEN
7292-7457 36 OPEN
7050-7231 36 OPEN

27. ACID, FRACTURE TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
8038-8192 1,493 BARRELS GELLEDWATER & 196,400# 20/40 SAND
7795-7995 961 BARRELS GELLED WATER & 116,700#20/40 SAND
7513-7749 977 BARRELS GELLED WATER & 119,600# 20/40 SAND
7292-7457 883 BARRELS GELLED WATER & 105,200#20/40 SAND
7050-7231 1,064 BARRELS GELLED WATER & 134,100#20/40 SAND

32. FORMATION (LOG) MARKERS
Middle Price River 7867
Lower Price River 8689
Sego



DECTIONALDRILUNG

Survey Certification Sheet
Company: EOG Resources
API # 43-047-51731
Well Name: Chapita Well Unit #1544-26D
SURFACE LOCATION
Uintah County, Utah
Sec. 26-T9S-R22E
447' From North Line, 501' From East Line
BOTTOM HOLE LOCATION @
9391' Measured Depth
9310.82' True Vertical Depth
-804.15' South, -102.12' West from Surface Location
Crescent Job Number: CA 12029 and CA 12143

Surveyed from a depth of 0.0'- 9391' MD
Type of survey: Crescent MWD(Measurement While Drilling)
Last Survey Date: March 16, 2012
Directional Supervisor: John Stringfellow

To whom it may concern,
I attached surveys in pdf and text format of the Chapita Well Unit 1544-26D well.

The data and calculations for this survey have been checked by me and conform to the
standards and procedures set forth by Crescent Directional Drilling.
This report represents a true and correct Directional Survey of this well based on the original data
obtained at the well site. Wellbore Coordinates are calculated using minimum curvature.

John Stringfellow
Directional Coordinator
Rocky Mtn. Region
Crescent Directional Drilling
Off. (307)266-6500
Cell.



500- T EOG Resources
M

Azimuths to True North
Uintah County Utah400- Magnetic North: 10.97°

Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU#1542-26D Control WellMagnetic Field

Latitude 40° O'46.951 NStrength:52300.4snT Longitude 109°23'55.640 W
Dip Angle: 65.88°

True #34 @ 5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)300-- Date:2011/12/09 Ground Levei 5015.0
Model: IGRF2010 Utah Central 4302

NAD1927 (NADCONCONUS)Tie into Surface Hole survey& Magnetic North is 10.97 East of True North (Magnetic Declination)
PBHL #1541200-

#1541 Projection to TD
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EOG Resources
Uintah County Utah

Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU#1544-26D ,, M

Latitude 40°0'46.958 N
Longitude 109° 23' 55.900 WOg feSOUTCOS True #34 @ 5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)

Ground Level 5015.0
Utah Central 4302

NAD 1927 (NADCONCONUS)
Magnetic North is 10.97° East of True North (Magnetic Declination)

ANNOTATIONS WELLBORE TARGET DETAILS

TVD MD Annotation Name TVD +NI-S +El-W Shape
2173.1 2213.0 Tie into Surface Hole surveys Wasatch #1544 4600.0 -792.6 -120.2 Point
9310.8 9391.0 Projection to TD Price River #1544 6920.0 -792.6 -120.2 Circle (Radius: 50.0)

PBHL#1544 9310.0 -792.6 -120.2 Point

-750-

1800-

Design: Wellbore #1 (CWU #1544-260/Wellbore #1)

0-- Created By: JBS Date: 12:47, April 30 2012

1600-

750-
1400-

1500-
1200-

2250- - T
Tie into Surface Hole surveys 1000- M Azimuths to True North

Magnetic North: 10.97°

Magnetic Field
3000- Strength: 52300.4snT

800- Dip Angle: 65.88°
Date: 12/09/2011- Model: (GRF2010

c 3750-
600-

L - Wasatch #1544
4500-

.c

400-

5250-
-

200-

Sec. 26-T9S-R22E

o
2 6000-

Price River #15446750-
-200-

7500-
-400-

Tie into Surface Hole surveys
8250-

-600-

9000-
-800-

PBHL#1544i
Projection to TD

9750- Projection to TD PBHL #‡544
-1000-

10500-

till i!II Illi liii lift 1200 ii,

-750 0 750 1500 2250 -800 -600 -400 -200 0 200 400 600

Vertical Section at 186.28° (1500 ftlin) West(-)/East(+) (400



eog resources

EOG Resources
Uintah County Utah
Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU #1544-26D
Wellbore #1

Design: Wellbore #1

Standard Survey Report
30 April,



eog resources Memoon

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @ 5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Project Uintah County Utah

Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah Central 4302

apita 11UÑit15 4 6D

Site Position: Northing: 618,708.27ft Latitude: 40° 0' 46.951 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,588,474.21 ft Longitude: 109° 23' 55.640 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0 ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 1.35 °

Well CWU #1544-26D

Well Position +N/-S 0.0 ft Northing: 618,708.51 ft Latitude: 40° O'46.958 N
+El-W 0.0 ft Easting: 2,588,454.03 ft Longitude: 109° 23' 55.900 W

Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 5,015.0ft

Wellbore Wellbore #1

IGRF2010 12/09/11 10.97 65.88 52,300

Design Wellbore #1
Audit Notes:
Version: 1.0 Phase: ACTUAL Tie On Depth: 0.0

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +N/-S +El-W Direction
(ft) (ft) (ft) (°)
0.0 0.0 0.0 186.28

Survey Program Date 04/12/12
From To

(ft) (ft) Survey (Wellbore) Tool Name Description

326.0 2,213.0 Surface Hole Surveys (Wellbore #1) MWD MWD - Standard
2,337.0 9,391.0 7 7/8" Hole Surveys (Wellbore #1) MWD MWD - Standard

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°/100ft) (°l100ft) (°l100ft)

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
326.0 0.44 243.40 326.0 -0.6 -1.1 0.7 0.13 0.13 0.00
356.0 0.75 222.00 356.0 -0.8 -1.4 0.9 1.25 1.03 -71.33

386.0 0.90 221.00 386.0 -1.1 -1.6 1.3 0.50 0.50 -3.33

416.0 1.30 223.00 416.0 -1.5 -2.0 1.7 1.34 1.33 6.67
446.0 1.50 212.00 446.0 -2.1 -2.5 2.3 1.11 0.67 -36.67

476.0 1.80 205.00 476.0 -2.9 -2.9 3.1 1.20 1.00 -23.33

506.0 2.10 207.40 505.9 -3.8 -3.3 4.1 1.04 1.00 8.00
536.0 2.80 201.00 535.9 -4.9 -3.8 5.3 2.50 2.33 -21.33

566.0 3.30 194.30 565.9 -6.5 -4.3 6.9 2.04 1.67 -22.33

596.0 3.90 192.30 595.8 -8.3 -4.7 8.8 2.04 2.00 -6.67

626.0 4.80 195.50 625.7 -10.5 -5.3 11.0 3.11 3.00 10.67

04/30/12 12:59:56PM Page 2 COMPASS 2003.16 Build



eog resources Survey Report

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D

Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +N/-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(ft) (°) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°l100ft) (°l100ft) (°/100ft)

656.0 5.40 193.90 655.6 -13.1 -6.0 13.7 2.06 2.00 -5.33

686.0 5.80 195.70 685.5 -15.9 -6.7 16.5 1.46 1.33 6.00
716.0 6.50 197.90 715.3 -19.0 -7.7 19.7 2.46 2.33 7.33
746.0 7.10 198.40 745.1 -22.4 -8.8 23.2 2.01 2.00 1.67
776.0 7.80 196.80 774.8 -26.1 -9.9 27.0 2.43 2.33 -5.33

806.0 8.70 194.50 804.5 -30.2 -11.1 31.2 3.19 3.00 -7.67

836.0 9.40 193.90 834.1 -34.8 -12.3 35.9 2.35 2.33 -2.00

866.0 10.20 190.70 863.7 -39.8
-13.3 41.0 3.23 2.67 -10.67

896.0 11.10 190.40 893.2 -45.2
-14.3 46.5 3.01 3.00 -1.00

926.0 12.00 190.00 922.6 -51.1 -15.4 52.5 3.01 3.00 -1.33

956.0 12.50 190.00 951.9 -57.4 -16.5 58.9 1.67 1.67 0.00
986.0 13.30 190.30 981.1 -64.0 -17.7 65.5 2.68 2.67 1.00

1,016.0 13.20 191.80 1,010.3 -70.7 -19.0 72.4 1.19 -0.33 5.00

1,046.0 13.20 190.70 1,039.6 -77.5 -20.3 79.2 0.84 0.00 -3.67

1,076.0 13.60 191.00 1,068.7 -84.3 -21.7 86.2 1.35 1.33 1.00
1,106.0 14.20 190.00 1,097.9 -91.4 -23.0 93.3 2.15 2.00 -3.33

1,136.0 14.20 188.10 1,126.9 -98.6 -24.1 100.7 1.55 0.00 -6.33

1,166.0 14.80 187.30 1,156.0 -106.1 -25.1 108.2 2.11 2.00 -2.67

1,196.0 14.60 188.10 1,185.0 -113.6 -26.2 115.8 0.95 -0.67 2.67
1,226.0 14.60 187.00 1,214.0 -121.1 -27.1 123.4 0.92 0.00 -3.67

1,256.0 14.60 186.30 1,243.1 -128.6 -28.0 130.9 0.59 0.00 -2.33

1,286.0 14.30 185.90 1,272.1 -136.1 -28.8 138.4 1.05 -1.00 -1.33

1,316.0 14.60 186.50 1,301.2 -143.5
-29.6 145.9 1.12 1.00 2.00

1,346.0 14.50 187.90 1,330.2 -151.0 -30.6 153.4 1.22 -0.33 4.67
1,376.0 14.50 187.30 1,359.3 -158.4 -31.6 160.9 0.50 0.00 -2.00

1,406.0 14.40 185.80 1,388.3 -165.9 -32.4 168.4 1.29 -0.33 -5.00

1,436.0 14.30 187.20 1,417.4 -173.3 -33.3 175.9 1.20 -0.33 4.67
1,466.0 14.30 186.20 1,446.4 -180.6 -34.1 183.3 0.82 0.00 -3.33

1,496.0 14.20 186.00 1,475.5 -188.0 -34.9 190.7 0.37 -0.33 -0.67

1,526.0 14.10 187.90 1,504.6 -195.3 -35.8 198.0 1.58 -0.33 6.33
1,556.0 14.10 187.40 1,533.7 -202.5 -36.8 205.3 0.41 0.00 -1.67

1,586.0 14.40 185.70 1,562.8 -209.8 -37.6 212.7 1.72 1.00 -5.67

1,616.0 14.70 185.50 1,591.8 -217.3 -38.3 220.2 1.01 1.00 -0.67

1,646.0 14.60 185.70 1,620.8 -224.9 -39.1 227.8 0.37 -0.33 0.67
1,676.0 14.70 185.80 1,649.9 -232.4 -39.8 235.4 0.34 0.33 0.33
1,706.0 14.70 185.50 1,678.9 -240.0 -40.6 243.0 0.25 0.00 -1.00

1,736.0 14.40 184.00 1,707.9 -247.5 -41.2 250.5 1.61 -1.00 -5.00

1,766.0 14.10 183.70 1,737.0 -254.9 -41.7 257.9 1.03 -1.00 -1.00

1,796.0 13.90 184.70 1,766.1 -262.1 -42.2 265.2 1.05 -0.67 3.33
1,826.0 13.70 181.80 1,795.2 -269.3 -42.7 272.3 2.40 -0.67 -9.67

1,856.0 13.80 182.90 1,824.4 -276.4 -42.9 279.4 0.93 0.33 3.67
1,886.0 13.80 182.50 1,853.5 -283.5 -43.3 286.6 0.32 0.00 -1.33

1,916.0 13.60 180.40 1,882.7 -290.6 -43.5 293.7 1.79 -0.67 -7.00

1,946.0 13.30 179.50 1,911.8 -297.6 -43.5 300.6 1.22 -1.00 -3.00

1,976.0 13.30 178.80 1,941.0 -304.5 -43.4 307.4 0.54 0.00 -2.33

2,006.0 12.80 177.70 1,970.3 -311.3 -43.2 314.1 1.86 -1.67 -3.67

2,036.0 12.70 178.50 1,999.5 -317.9 -42.9 320.7 0.68 -0.33 2.67
2,066.0 12.10 175.40 2,028.8 -324.3 -42.6 327.1 2.99 -2.00 -10.33

2,096.0 11.80 175.00 2,058.2 -330.5 -42.1 333.1 1.04 -1.00 -1.33

2,126.0 11.00 172.30 2,087.6 -336.4 -41.4 338.9 3.20 -2.67 -9.00

2,156.0 10.70 170.60 2,117.0 -342.0 -40.6 344.4 1.46 -1.00 -5.67

2,186.0 10.30 169.50 2,146.5 -347.4 -39.6 349.6 1.49 -1.33 -3.67

2,213.0 10.00 168.30 2,173.1 -352.1 -38.7 354.2 1.36 -1.11 -4.44

Tie into Surface Hole surveys
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Survey ReportWoog resources
Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate(°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (*I100ft) (°I100ft) (°/100ft)

2,337.0 8.60 163.50 2,295.5 -371.5 -33.9 373.0 1.29 -1.13 -3.87

2,368.0 8.30 162.30 2,326.1 -375.8 -32.6 377.2 1.12 -0.97 -3.87

2,399.0 8.40 163.90 2,356.8 -380.2 -31.3 381.3 0.82 0.32 5.16
2,431.0 8.90 166.80 2,388.5 -384.8 -30.0 385.8 2.07 1.56 9.06
2,461.0 9.40 170.80 2,418.1 -389.5 -29.1 390.3 2.70 1.67 13.33

2,493.0 9.50 173.20 2,449.6 -394.7 -28.4 395.4 1.27 0.31 7.50
2,523.0 9.50 173.70 2,479.2 -399.6 -27.8 400.3 0.28 0.00 1.67
2,555.0 9.30 176.60 2,510.8 -404.8 -27.4 405.4 1.61 -0.62 9.06
2,587.0 9.50 178.50 2,542.4 -410.0 -27.2 410.5 1.15 0.62 5.94
2,618.0 9.80 180.10 2,572.9 -415.2 -27.1 415.7 1.30 0.97 5.16

2,649.0 9.90 181.30 2,603.5 -420.5 -27.2 421.0 0.74 0.32 3.87
2,680.0 9.90 182.40 2,634.0 -425.9 -27.3 426.3 0.61 0.00 3.55
2,712.0 9.80 183.40 2,665.5 -431.3 -27.6 431.8 0.62 -0.31 3.12
2,743.0 10.10 185.40 2,696.1 -436.7 -28.0 437.1 1.48 0.97 6.45
2,774.0 10.50 187.80 2,726.6 -442.2 -28.7 442.7 1.89 1.29 7.74

2,806.0 10.90 189.00 2,758.0 -448.0 -29.5 448.6 1.43 1.25 3.75
2,836.0 11.30 191.00 2,787.5 -453.7 -30.5 454.4 1.85 1.33 6.67
2,868.0 11.70 195.10 2,818.8 -459.9 -32.0 460.7 2.84 1.25 12.81
2,900.0 12.00 198.00 2,850.1 -466.2 -33.9 467.1 2.08 0.94 9.06
2,931.0 12.10 200.90 2,880.5 -472.3 -36.0 473.4 1.98 0.32 9.35
2,963.0 12.00 201.30 2,911.7 -478.6 -38.4 479.9 0.41 -0.31 1.25
2,994.0 12.00 199.60 2,942.1 -484.6 -40.7 486.2 1.14 0.00 -5.48

3,024.0 12.20 199.50 2,971.4 -490.5 -42.8 492.3 0.67 0.67 -0.33

3,056.0 12.90 200.30 3,002.6 -497.1 -45.1 499.0 2.25 2.19 2.50
3,087.0 13.40 202.70 3,032.8 -503.6 -47.7 505.8 2.39 1.61 7.74

3,119.0 13.80 203.70 3,063.9 -510.5 -50.7 513.0 1.45 1.25 3.12
3,149.0 13.80 203.30 3,093.1 -517.1 -53.5 519.9 0.32 0.00 -1.33

3,179.0 13.40 201.60 3,122.2 -523.6 -56.2 526.6 1.88 -1.33 -5.67

3,210.0 13.10 201.30 3,152.4 -530.2 -58.8 533.5 0.99 -0.97 -0.97

3,242.0 13.30 199.30 3,183.5 -537.1 -61.4 540.6 1.56 0.62 -6.25

3,274.0 13.60 198.20 3,214.7 -544.1 -63.8 547.9 1.23 0.94 -3.44

3,304.0 13.70 199.40 3,243.8 -550.8 -66.0 554.8 1.00 0.33 4.00
3,336.0 13.60 202.10 3,274.9 -557.9 -68.7 562.1 2.02 -0.31 8.44
3,366.0 13.00 201.50 3,304.1 -564.3 -71.3 568.7 2.05 -2.00 -2.00

3,398.0 12.90 201.90 3,335.3 -571.0 -73.9 575.6 0.42 -0.31 1.25
3,428.0 12.90 201.50 3,364.5 -577.2 -76.4 582.1 0.30 0.00 -1.33

3,460.0 12.80 199.80 3,395.7 -583.9 -78.9 589.0 1.22 -0.31 -5.31

3,490.0 13.00 199.70 3,425.0 -590.2 -81.2 595.5 0.67 0.67 -0.33

3,522.0 13.10 202.10 3,456.2 -596.9 -83.8 602.5 1.72 0.31 7.50
3,552.0 12.60 202.00 3,485.4 -603.1 -86.3 608.9 1.67 -1.67 -0.33

3,583.0 12.10 200.60 3,515.7 -609.3 -88.7 615.3 1.88 -1.61 -4.52

3,613.0 12.10 199.80 3,545.0 -615.2 -90.9 621.4 0.56 0.00 -2.67

3,644.0 12.40 200.90 3,575.3 -621.3 -93.1 627.8 1.23 0.97 3.55
3,675.0 12.90 201.10 3,605.6 -627.7 -95.6 634.4 1.62 1.61 0.65
3,706.0 12.60 199.80 3,635.8 -634.1 -98.0 641.0 1.34 -0.97 -4.19

3,736.0 11.80 198.70 3,665.1 -640.1 -100.1 647.2 2.78 -2.67 -3.67

3,768.0 11.60 198.60 3,696.5 -646.2 -102.1 653.5 0.63 -0.62 -0.31

3,799.0 11.40 198.10 3,726.8 -652.1 -104.1 659.6 0.72 -0.65 -1.61

3,831.0 11.00 197.70 3,758.2 -658.0 -106.0 665.6 1.27 -1.25 -1.25

3,863.0 11.20 197.10 3,789.6 -663.9 -107.8 671.7 0.72 0.62 -1.87

3,894.0 11.10 197.60 3,820.0 -669.6 -109.6 677.6 0.45 -0.32 1.61
3,925.0 10.50 196.30 3,850.5 -675.2 -111.3 683.3 2.09 -1.94 -4.19

3,957.0 9.80 194.90 3,882.0 -680.6 -112.8 688.8 2.32 -2.19 -4.37

3,989.0 9.60 197.30 3,913.5 -685.8 -114.3 694.2 1.41 -0.62 7.50
4Ñî9 9.60 2Q160 1943.1 -§90.5

-1194 699 0 _ 219 _ gg0 14.33
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Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034,0ft (RKB Elev.)
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(II) (°) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (*/100ft) (*/100ft) (°l100ft)

4,051.0 9.30 202.70 3,974.7 -695.3 -118.0 704.1 1.09 -0.94 3.44
4,081.0 8.80 201.90 4,004.3 -699.7 -119.8 708.6 1.72 -1.67 -2.67

4,113.0 8.40 200.50 4,035.9 -704.2 -121.5 713.2 1.41 -1.25 -4.37

4,143.0 8.10 200.20 4,065.6 -708.2 -123.0 717.4 1.01 -1.00 -1.00

4,175.0 7.70 198.70 4,097.3 -712.4 -124.5 721.7 1.41 -1.25 -4.69

4,207.0 7.30 197.40 4,129.1 -716.3 -125.8 725.8 1.36 -1.25 -4.06

4,239.0 7.00 196.80 4,160.8 -720.1 -126.9 729.7 0.97 -0.94 -1.87

4,269.0 6.90 196.50 4,190.6 -723.6 -128.0 733.3 0.35 -0.33 -1.00

4,301.0 6.50 198.30 4,222.4 -727.2 -129.1 736.9 1.41 -1.25 5.62
4,332.0 6.10 201.40 4,253.2 -730.4 -130.2 740.2 1.69 -1.29 10.00
4,363.0 5.60 202.00 4,284.0 -733.3 -131.4 743.3 1.62 -1.61 1.94
4,395.0 5.10 200.40 4,315.9 -736.1 -132.5 746.2 1.63 -1.56 -5.00

4,425.0 4.60 201.00 4,345.8 -738.5 -133.4 748.6 1.68 -1.67 2.00
4,457.0 3.80 205.60 4,377.7 -740.6 -134.3 750.9 2.71 -2.50 14.37
4,487.0 2.90 207.60 4,407.6 -742.2 -135.1 752.5 3.02 -3.00 6.67

4,519.0 2.40 207.60 4,439.6 -743.5 -135.8 753.9 1.56 -1.56 0.00
4,549.0 2.40 206.70 4,469.6 -744.6 -136.3 755.1 0.13 0.00 -3.00

4,581.0 2.40 207.60 4,501.6 -745.8 -136.9 756.3 0.12 0.00 2.81
4,613.0 2.10 203.60 4,533.5 -746.9 -137.5 757.5 1.06 -0.94 -12.50

4,643.0 1.50 206.20 4,563.5 -747.8 -137.9 758.4 2.02 -2.00 8.67
4,675.0 1.10 176.60 4,595.5 -748.5 -138.0 759.1 2.40 -1.25 -92.50

4,680.4 1.07 170.85 4,600.9 -748.6 -138.0 759.2 2.09 -0.49 -107.06

Wasatch #1544
4,705.0 1.10 143.50 4,625.5 -749.0 -137.9 759.6 2.09 0.11 -111.05

4,737.0 1.30 137.30 4,657.5 -749.5 -137.4 760.0 0.74 0.62 -19.37

4,768.0 1.00 144.20 4,688.5 -750.0 -137.0 760.5 1.06 -0.97 22.26

4,799.0 0.80 148.10 4,719.5 -750.4 -136.8 760.8 0.67 -0.65 12.58
4,831.0 0.70 145.10 4,751.5 -750.7 -136.5 761.2 0.34 -0.31 -9.37

4,862.0 0.30 102.90 4,782.5 -750.9 -136.3 761.3 1.67 -1.29 -136.13

4,924.0 0.40 17.40 4,844.5 -750.7 -136.1 761.1 0.78 0.16 -137.90

5,019.0 0.40 12.30 4,939.5 -750.1 -136.0 760.5 0.04 0.00 -5.37

5,112.0 0.30 5.20 5,032.5 -749.5 -135.9 759.9 0.12 -0.11 -7.63

5,205.0 0.40 12.80 5,125.5 -749.0 -135.8 759.3 0.12 0.11 8.17
5,297.0 0.30 205.90 5,217.5 -748.9 -135.8 759.2 0.76 -0.11 -181.41

5,390.0 0.60 183.60 5,310.5 -749.6 -135.9 760.0 0.37 0.32 -23.98

5,485.0 0.70 180.00 5,405.5 -750.7 -136.0 761.0 0.11 0.11 -3.79

5,579.0 1.00 181.30 5,499.5 -752.1 -136.0 762.4 0.32 0.32 1.38
5,673.0 0.60 163.40 5,593.4 -753.4 -135.9 763.7 0.50 -0.43 -19.04

5,766.0 0.80 163.70 5,686.4 -754.4 -135.5 764.7 0.22 0.22 0.32
5,861.0 0.80 161.80 5,781.4 -755.7 -135.1 766.0 0.03 0.00 -2.00

5,956.0 0.80 165.70 5,876.4 -757.0 -134.8 767.2 0.06 0.00 4.11
6,049.0 0.30 102.40 5,969.4 -757.7 -134.4 767.8 0.77 -0.54 -68.06

6,144.0 0.50 119.80 6,064.4 -757.9 -133.8 768.0 0.24 0.21 18.32
6,239.0 0.60 130.10 6,159.4 -758.5 -133.0 768.4 0.15 0.11 10.84
6,333.0 0.60 132.60 6,253.4 -759.1 -132.3 769.0 0.03 0.00 2.66
6,427.0 0.70 133.50 6,347.4 -759.8 -131.5 769.7 0.11 0.11 0.96

6,521.0 1.10 129.40 6,441.4 -760.8 -130.4 770.5 0.43 0.43 -4.36

6,616.0 0.70 180.20 6,536.4 -762.0 -129.7 771.6 0.90 -0.42 53.47
6,708.0 0.90 174.60 6,628.4 -763.2 -129.6 772.8 0.23 0.22 -6.09

6,802.0 0.70 162.60 6,722.4 -764.5 -129.4 774.1 0.28 -0.21 -12.77

6,896.0 0.80 170.50 6,816.3 -765.7 -129.1 775.2 0.15 0.11 8.40
6,991.0 0.90 179.80 6,911.3 -767.1 -129.0 776.6 0.18 0.11 9.79
7,000.0 0.86 179.20 6,920.3 -767.3 -129.0 776.8 0.44 -0.43 -6.68

Price River #1544
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Survey Reportog resources
Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Weilbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(II) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°Ii00ft) (°l100ft) (*l100ft)

7,086.0 0.50 168.80 7,006.3 -768.3 -128.9 777.8 0.44 -0.42 -12.09

7,180.0 0.40 145.50 7,100.3 -768.9 -128.7 778.4 0.22 -0.11 -24.79

7,274.0 0.60 166.10 7,194.3 -769.7 -128.4 779.1 0.28 0.21 21.91

7,368.0 0.70 165.20 7,288.3 -770.7 -128.1 780.1 0.11 0.11 -0.96

7,462.0 0.90 167.50 7,382.3 -772.0 -127.8 781.3 0.22 0.21 2.45
7,558.0 1.20 164.50 7,478.3 -773.7 -127.3 783.0 0.32 0.31 -3.12

7,651.0 0.90 161.00 7,571.3 -775.3 -126.9 784.6 0.33 -0.32 -3.76

7,746.0 1.10 161.60 7,666.3 -776.9 -126.3 786.1 0.21 0.21 0.63
7,838.0 1.20 161.20 7,758.2 -778.7 -125.7 787.7 0.11 0.11 -0.43

7,932.0 1.30 159.30 7,852.2 -780.6 -125.0 789.6 0.12 0.11 -2.02

8,026.0 1.20 150.00 7,946.2 -782.4 -124.2 791.3 0.24 -0.11 -9.89

8,119.0 1.40 156.50 8,039.2 -784.3 -123.2 793.1 0.27 0.22 6.99
8,212.0 1.60 148.40 8,132.1 -786.5 -122.1 795.1 0.31 0.22 -8.71

8,306.0 1.10 133.20 8,226.1 -788.2 -120.7 796.7 0.65 -0.53 -16.17

8,399.0 1.10 122.60 8,319.1 -789.3 -119.3 797.6 0.22 0.00 -11.40

8,493.0 1.00 131.30 8,413.1 -790.3 -118.0 798.5 0.20 -0.11 9.26
8,589.0 1.00 136.50 8,509.1 -791.5 -116.8 799.5 0.09 0.00 5.42
8,627.0 0.90 136.00 8,547.1 -791.9 -116.3 799.9 0.26 -0.26 -1.32

8,681.0 0.90 126.00 8,601.1 -792.5 -115.7 800.4 0.29 0.00 -18.52

8,774.0 1.40 128.90 8,694.0 -793.6 -114.2 801.4 0.54 0.54 3.12
8,868.0 1.10 127.90 8,788.0 -794.9 -112.6 802.5 0.32 -0.32 -1.06

8,963.0 1.30 142.10 8,883.0 -796.3 -111.2 803.7 0.38 0.21 14.95
9,057.0 1.30 149.40 8,977.0 -798.1 -110.0 805.3 0.18 0.00 7.77

9,151.0 1.70 130.30 9,070.9 -799.9 -108.4 807.0 0.68 0.43 -20.32

9,245.0 1.90 122.20 9,164.9 -801.6 -106.0 808.4 0.34 0.21 -8.62

9,336.0 1.80 122.90 9,25g.8 -803.2 -103.6 809.7 0.11 -0.11 0.77
9,389.5 1.80 122.90 9,309.3 -804.1 -102.2 810.5 0.00 0.00 0.00

PBHL #1544
9,391.0 1.80 122.90 9,310.8 -804.1 -102.1 810.5 0.00 0.00 0.00

Projection to TD
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Survey ReportW1eogresources sa on

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev )
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev )
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Targets

Target Name
- hit/miss target Dip Angle Dip Dir. TVD +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting
- Shape (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

PBHL #1544 0.00 0.00 9,310.0 -792.6 -120.2 617,913.32 2,588,352.52 40° O' 39.125 N 109° 23' 57.444 W
- actual wellpath misses target center by 21.4ft at 9389.5ft MD (9309.3 TVD, -804.1 N, -102.2 E)
- Point

Wasatch #1544 0.00 0.00 4,600.0 -792.6 -120.2 617,913.32 2,588,352.52 40° O'39.125 N 109° 23' 57.444 W
- actual wellpath misses target center by 47.5ft at 4680.4ft MD (4600.9 TVD, -748.6 N, -138.0 E)
- Point

Price River #1544 0.00 0.00 6,920.0 -792.6 -120.2 617,913.32 2,588,352.52 40° O'39.125 N 109° 23' 57.444 W
- actual wellpath misses target center by 26.8ft at 7000.0ft MD (6920.3 TVD, -767.3 N, -129.0 E)
- Circle (radius 50.0)

2,213.0 2,173.1 -352.1 -38.7 Tie into Surface Hole surveys
9,391.0 9,310.8 -804.1 -102.1 Projection to TD

Checked By: Approved By: Date:
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eog resources
EOG Resources
Uintah County Utah
Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D
CWU #1544-26D
Wellbore #1

Design: Wellbore #1

Survey Report - Geographic
30 April,



Survey Report - Geographic
Woog resources on

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Project Uintah County Utah

Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah Central 4302

Site Position: Northing: 618,708.27ft Latitude: 40° O'46.951 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,588,474.21ft Longitude: 109° 23' 55.640 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0 ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 1.35 °

Well CWU #1544-26D

Well Position +N/-S 0.0 ft North ing: 618,708.51 ft Latitude: 40° O'46.958 N
+El-W 0.0 ft Easting: 2,588,454.03 ft Longitude: 109° 23' 55.900 W

Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 5,015.0ft

Wellbore Weilbore #1

IGRF2010 12/09/11 10.97 65.88 52,300

Design Wellbore #1

Audit Notes:

Version: 1.0 Phase: ACTUAL Tie On Depth: 0.0

Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +NI-S +El-W Direction
(ft) (ft) (ft) (*)
0.0 0.0 0.0 186.28

Survey Program Date 04/12/12

From To
(ft) (ft) Survey (Wellbore) Tool Name Description

326.0 2,213.0 Surface Hole Surveys (Wellbore #1) MWD MWD - Standard
2,337.0 9,391.0 7 7/8" Hole Surveys (Wellbore #1) MWD MWD - Standard
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Survey Report - Geographic
Wieog resources os

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D

Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034 Oft(RKB Elev )
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034 Oft(RKB Elev )
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003 16 Single User Db

, Survey

Measured Vertical Map Map
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting

(°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft} (ft) (II) Latitude Longitude

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 618,708.51 2,588,454.03 40° O'46.958 N 109° 23' 55.900 W
326.0 0.44 243.40 326.0 -0.6 -1.1 618,707.92 2,588,452.93 40° O'46.953 N 109° 23' 55.914 W
356.0 0.75 222.00 356.0 -0.8 -1.4 618,707.72 2,588,452.70 40° O'46.951 N 109° 23' 55.917 W
386.0 0.90 221.00 386.0 -1.1 -1.6 618,707.39 2,588,452.42 40° O'46.948 N 109° 23' 55.921 W
416.0 1.30 223.00 416.0 -1.5 -2.0 618,706.95 2,588,452.04 40° O' 46.943 N 109° 23' 55.926 W
446.0 1.50 212.00 446.0 -2.1 -2.5 618,706.36 2,588,451.62 40° O' 46.938 N 109° 23' 55.931 W
476.0 1.80 205.00 476.0 -2.9 -2.9 618,705.59 2,588,451.23 40° O' 46.930 N 109° 23' 55.937 W
506.0 2.10 207.40 505.9 -3.8 -3.3 618,704.67 2,588,450.80 40° O' 46.921 N 109° 23' 55.942 W
536.0 2.80 201.00 535.9 -4.9 -3.8 618,703.48 2,588,450.31 40° O' 46.909 N 109° 23' 55.949 W
566.0 3.30 194.30 565.9 -6.5 -4.3 618,701.95 2,588,449.87 40° O' 46.894 N 109° 23' 55.955 W
596.0 3.90 192.30 595.8 -8.3 -4.7 618,700.11 2,588,449.48 40° O'46.876 N 109° 23' 55.961 W
626.0 4.80 195.50 625.7 -10.5 -5.3 618,697.89 2,588,448.98 40° O'46.854 N 109° 23' 55.968 W
656.0 5.40 193.90 655.6 -13.1 -6.0 618,695.29 2,588,448.37 40° O' 46.829 N 109° 23' 55.976 W
686.0 5.80 195.70 685.5 -15.9 -6.7 618,692.45 2,588,447.68 40° O' 46.801 N 109° 23' 55.986 W
716.0 6.50 197.90 715.3 -19.0 -7.7 618,689.35 2,588,446.82 40° O' 46.771 N 109° 23' 55.998 W
746.0 7.10 198.40 745.1 -22.4 -8.8 618,685.95 2,588,445.80 40° O' 46.737 N 109° 23' 56.012 W
776.0 7.80 196.80 774.8 -26.1 -9.9 618,682.22 2,588,444.71 40° O'46.701 N 109° 23' 56.027 W
806.0 8.70 194.50 804.5 -30.2 -11.1 618,678.05 2,588,443.65 40° O'46.660 N 109° 23' 56.042 W
836.0 9.40 193.90 834.1 -34.8 -12.3 618,673.44 2,588,442.60 40° O'46.614 N 109° 23' 56.057 W
866.0 10.20 190.70 863.7 -39.8 -13.3 618,668.43 2,588,441.64 40° O'46.565 N 109° 23' 56.071 W
896.0 11.10 190.40 893.2 -45.2 -14.3 618,662.96 2,588,440.75 40° O'46.511 N 109° 23' 56.084 W
926.0 12.00 190.00 922.6 -51.1 -15.4 618,657.02 2,588,439.83 40° O'46.453 N 109° 23' 56.098 W
956.0 12.50 190.00 951.9 -57.4 -16.5 618,650.73 2,588,438.87 40° O'46.391 N 109° 23' 56.112 W
986.0 13.30 190.30 981.1 -64.0 -17.7 618,644.11 2,588,437.85 40° O'46.326 N 109° 23' 56.127 W

1,016.0 13.20 191.80 1,010.3 -70.7 -19.0 618,637.34 2,588,436.69 40° O'46.259 N 109° 23' 56.144 W
1,046.0 13.20 190.70 1,039.6 -77.5 -20.3 618,630.59 2,588,435.51 40° O'46.193 N 109° 23' 56.161 W
1,076.0 13.60 191.00 1,068.7 -84.3 -21.7 618,623.73 2,588,434.36 40° O' 46.125 N 109° 23' 56.178 W
1,106.0 14.20 190.00 1,097.9 -91.4 -23.0 618,616.62 2,588,433.22 40° O' 46.055 N 109° 23' 56.195 W
1,136.0 14.20 188.10 1,126.9 -98.6 -24.1 618,609.32 2,588,432.23 40° O' 45.983 N 109° 23' 56.210 W
1,166.0 14.80 187.30 1,156.0 -106.1 -25.1 618,601.86 2,588,431.40 40° O' 45.910 N 109° 23' 56.223 W
1,196.0 14.60 188.10 1,185.0 -113.6 -26.2 618,594.29 2,588,430.56 40° O'45.835 N 109° 23' 56.236 W
1,226.0 14.60 187.00 1,214.0 -121.1 -27.1 618,586.78 2,588,429.74 40° O'45.761 N 109° 23' 56.249 W
1,256.0 14.60 186.30 1,243.1 -128.6 -28.0 618,579.25 2,588,429.04 40° O'45.687 N 109° 23' 56.260 W
1,286.0 14.30 185.90 1,272.1 -136.1 -28.8 618,571.79 2,588,428.42 40° O'45.613 N 109° 23' 56.270 W
1,316.0 14.60 186.50 1,301.2 -143.5 -29.6 618,564.33 2,588,427.79 40° O'45.540 N 109° 23' 56.280 W
1,346.0 14.50 187.90 1,330.2 -151.0 -30.6 618,556.83 2,588,427.02 40° O' 45.466 N 109° 23' 56.293 W
1,376.0 14.50 187.30 1,359.3 -158.4 -31.6 618,549.36 2,588,426.20 40° O'45.392 N 109° 23' 56.305 W
1,406.0 14.40 185.80 1,388.3 -165.9 -32.4 618,541.91 2,588,425.52 40° O'45.319 N 109° 23' 56.316 W
1,436.0 14.30 187.20 1,417.4 -173.3 -33.3 618,534.50 2,588,424.85 40° O'45.246 N 109° 23' 56.327 W
1,466.0 14.30 186.20 1,446.4 -180.6 -34.1 618,527.13 2,588,424.16 40° O'45.173 N 109° 23' 56.338 W
1,496.0 14.20 186.00 1,475.5 -188.0 -34.9 618,519.77 2,588,423.55 40° O' 45.100 N 109° 23' 56.348 W
1,526.0 14.10 187.90 1,504.6 -195.3 -35.8 618,512.47 2,588,422.83 40° O' 45.028 N 109° 23' 56.360 W
1,556.0 14.10 187.40 1,533.7 -202.5 -36.8 618,505.21 2,588,422.03 40° O'44.957 N 109° 23' 56.372 W
1,586.0 14.40 185.70 1,562.8 -209.8 -37.6 618,497.85 2,588,421.36 40° O'44.884 N 109° 23' 56.383 W
1,616.0 14.70 185.50 1,591.8 -217.3 -38.3 618,490.34 2,588,420.80 40° O'44.810 N 109° 23' 56.392 W
1,646.0 14.60 185.70 1,620.8 -224.9 -39.1 618,482.77 2,588,420.24 40° O'44.736 N 109° 23' 56.402 W
1,676.0 14.70 185.80 1,649.9 -232.4 -39.8 618,475.20 2,588,419.66 40° O'44.661 N 109° 23' 56.412 W
1,706.0 14.70 185.50 1,678.9 -240.0 -40.6 618,467.61 2,588,419.09 40° O'44.586 N 109° 23' 56.421 W
1,736.0 14.40 184.00 1,707.9 -247.5 -41.2 618,460.09 2,588,418.64 40° O'44.512 N 109° 23' 56.429 W
1,766.0 14.10 183.70 1,737.0 -254.9 -41.7 618,452.71 2,588,418.32 40° O'44.439 N 109° 23' 56.436 W
1,796.0 13.90 184.70 1,766.1 -262.1 -42.2 618,445.46 2,588,417.95 40° O'44.368 N 109° 23' 56.443 W
1,826.0 13.70 181.80 1,795.2 -269.3 -42.7 618,438.31 2,588,417.72 40° O'44.297 N 109° 23' 56.448 W
1,856.0 13.80 182.90 1,824.4 -276.4 -42.9 618,431.19 2,588,417.59 40° O'44.227 N 109° 23' 56.452 W
1,886.0 13.80 182.50 1,853.5 -283.5 -43.3 618,424.03 2,588,417.42 40° O'44.156 N 109° 23' 56.456 W
1,916.0 13.60 180.40 1,882.7 --290.6 -43.5 618,416.93 2,588,417.41 40° O'44.086 N 109° 23' 56.458 W

04/30/12 1:00:52PM Page 3 COMPASS 2003.16 Build



og resources Suntey Report - Geographic

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Map Map
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting

(ft) (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (II) (ft) Latitude Longitude

1,946.0 13.30 179.50 1,911.8 -297.6 -43.5 618,409.95 2,588,417.58 40° O' 44.017 N 109° 23' 56.458 W
1,976.0 13.30 178.80 1,941.0 -304.5 -43.4 618,403.06 2,588,417.84 40° O' 43.949 N 109° 23' 56.457 W
2,006.0 12.80 177.70 1,970.3 -311.3 -43.2 618,396.29 2,588,418.21 40° O' 43.882 N 109° 23' 56.454 W
2,036.0 12.70 178.50 1,999.5 -317.9 -42.9 618,389.68 2,588,418.58 40° O' 43.816 N 109° 23' 56.451 W
2,066.0 12.10 175.40 2,028.8 -324.3 -42.6 618,383.26 2,588,419.07 40° O'43.753 N 109° 23' 56.447 W
2,096.0 11.80 175.00 2,058.2 -330.5 -42.1 618,377.08 2,588,419.74 40° O'43.691 N 109° 23' 56.440 W
2,126.0 11.00 172.30 2,087.6 -336.4 -41.4 618,371.21 2,588,420.52 40° O'43.633 N 109° 23' 56.432 W
2,156.0 10.70 170.60 2,117.0 -342.0 -40.6 618,365.65 2,588,421.49 40° O'43.578 N 109° 23' 56.421 W
2,186.0 10.30 169.50 2,146.5 -347.4 -39.6 618,360.29 2,588,422.56 40° O'43.525 N 109° 23' 56.409 W
2,213.0 10.00 168.30 2,173.1 -352.1 -38.7 618,355.64 2,588,423.59 40° O'43.479 N 109° 23' 56.397 W
Tie into Surface Hole surveys
2,337.0 8.60 163.50 2,295.5 -371.5 -33.9 618,336.32 2,588,428.86 40° 0' 43.287 N 109° 23' 56.335 W
2,368.0 8.30 162.30 2,326.1 -375.8 -32.6 618,332.00 2,588,430.30 40° O'43.244 N 109° 23' 56.318 W
2,399.0 8.40 163.90 2,356.8 -380.2 -31.3 618,327.73 2,588,431.71 40° O' 43.201 N 109° 23' 56.301 W
2,431.0 8.90 166.80 2,388.5 -384.8 -30.0 618,323.10 2,588,433.03 40° O'43.155 N 109° 23' 56.286 W
2,461.0 9.40 170.80 2,418.1 -389.5 -29.1 618,318.45 2,588,434.06 40° O'43.109 N 109° 23' 56.274 W
2,493.0 9.50 173.20 2,449.6 -394.7 -28.4 618,313.26 2,588,434.92 40° O'43.057 N 109° 23' 56.265 W
2,523.0 9.50 173.70 2,479.2 -399.6 -27.8 618,308.36 2,588,435.60 40° O' 43.009 N 109° 23' 56.257 W
2,555.0 9.30 176.60 2,510.8 -404.8 -27.4 618,303.17 2,588,436.16 40° O'42.957 N 109° 23' 56.252 W
2,587.0 9.50 178.50 2,542.4 -410.0 -27.2 618,297.95 2,588,436.51 40° O'42.906 N 109° 23' 56.249 W
2,618.0 9.80 180.10 2,572.9 -415.2 -27.1 618,292.76 2,588,436.69 40° O'42.854 N 109° 23' 56.248 W
2,649.0 9.90 181.30 2,603.5 -420.5

-27.2 618,287.46 2,588,436.75 40° O'42.802 N 109° 23' 56.249 W
2,680.0 9.90 182.40 2,634.0 -425.9 -27.3 618,282.13 2,588,436.70 40° O' 42.749 N 109° 23' 56.251 W
2,712.0 9.80 183.40 2,665.5 -431.3 -27.6 618,276.65 2,588,436.55 40° O' 42.695 N 109° 23' 56.255 W
2,743.0 10.10 185.40 2,696.1 -436.7 -28.0 618,271.31 2,588,436.27 40° O'42.642 N 109° 23' 56.260 W
2,774.0 10.50 187.80 2,726.6 -442.2 -28.7 618,265.79 2,588,435.76 40° O'42.588 N 109° 23' 56.268 W
2,806.0 10.90 189.00 2,758.0 -448.0 -29.5 618,259.89 2,588,435.03 40° O'42.530 N 109° 23' 56.279 W
2,836.0 11.30 191.00 2,787.5 -453.7 -30.5 618,254.18 2,588,434.16 40° O'42.474 N 109° 23' 56.292 W
2,868.0 11.70 195.10 2,818.8 -459.9 -32.0 618,247.94 2,588,432.86 40° O' 42.412 N 109° 23' 56.311 W
2,900.0 12.00 198.00 2,850.1 -466.2 -33.9 618,241.60 2,588,431.13 40° O' 42.350 N 109° 23' 56.335 W
2,931.0 12.10 200.90 2,880.5 -472.3 -36.0 618,235.45 2,588,429.12 40° 0' 42.290 N 109° 23' 56.362 W
2,963.0 12.00 201.30 2,911.7 -478.6 -38.4 618,229.17 2,588,426.87 40° O' 42.228 N 109° 23' 56.393 W
2,994.0 12.00 199.60 2,942.1 -484.6 -40.7 618,223.08 2,588,424.76 40° O'42.169 N 109° 23' 56.422 W
3,024.0 12.20 199.50 2,971.4 -490.5 -42.8 618,217.10 2,588,422.79 40° O' 42.110 N 109° 23' 56.449 W
3,056.0 12.90 200.30 3,002.6 -497.1 -45.1 618,210.51 2,588,420.58 40° O'42.045 N 109° 23' 56.480 W
3,087.0 13.40 202.70 3,032.8 -503.6 -47.7 618,203.89 2,588,418.15 40° O'41.981 N 109° 23' 56.513 W
3,119.0 13.80 203.70 3,063.9 -510.5 -50.7 618,196.91 2,588,415.34 40° O'41.912 N 109° 23' 56.551 W
3,149.0 13.80 203.30 3,093.1 -517.1 -53.5 618,190.28 2,588,412.65 40° O'41.847 N 109° 23' 56.588 W
3,179.0 13.40 201.60 3,122.2 -523.6 -56.2 618,183.70 2,588,410.11 40° O'41.783 N 109° 23' 56.622 W
3,210.0 13.10 201.30 3,152.4. -530.2 -58.8 618,177.03 2,588,407.66 40° O'41.718 N 109° 23' 56.656 W
3,242.0 13.30 199.30 3,183.5 -537.1 -61.4 618,170.12 2,588,405.29 40° O'41.650 N 109° 23' 56.688 W
3,274.0 13.60 198.20 3,214.7 -544.1 -63.8 618,163.02 2,588,403.07 40° O'41.580 N 109° 23' 56.719 W
3,304.0 13.70 199.40 3,243.8 -550.8 -66.0 618,156.26 2,588,400.94 40° O'41.514 N 109° 23' 56.749 W
3,336.0 13.60 202.10 3,274.9 -557.9 -68.7 618,149.14 2,588,398.43 40° O'41.444 N 109° 23' 56.783 W
3,366.0 13.00 201.50 3,304.1 -564.3 -71.3 618,142.68 2,588,396.02 40° O' 41.381 N 109° 23' 56.816 W
3,398.0 12.90 201.90 3,335.3 -571.0 -73.9 618,135.95 2,588,393,53 40° O' 41.315 N 109° 23' 56.850 W
3,428.0 12.90 201.50 3,364.5 -577.2 -76.4 618,129.67 2,588,391.20 40° O'41.254 N 109° 23' 56.882 W
3,460.0 12.80 199.80 3,395.7 -583.9 -78.9 618,122.96 2,588,388.85 40° O' 41.188 N 109° 23' 56.914 W
3,490.0 13.00 199.70 3,425.0 -590.2 -81.2 618,116.60 2,588,386.73 40° O'41.125 N 109° 23' 56.943 W
3,522.0 13.10 202.10 3,456.2 -596.9 -83.8 618,109.80 2,588,384.31 40° O' 41.059 N 109° 23' 56.976 W
3,552.0 12.60 202.00 3,485.4 -603.1 -86.3 618,103.56 2,588,381.95 40° O' 40.998 N 109° 23' 57.008 W
3,583.0 12.10 200.60 3,515.7 -609.3 -88.7 618,097.32 2,588,379.69 40° O' 40.937 N 109° 23' 57.039 W
3,613.0 12.10 199.80 3,545.0 -615.2 -90.9 618,091.37 2,588,377.66 40° O' 40.878 N 109° 23' 57.067 W
3,644.0 12.40 200.90 3,575,3 -621.3 -93.1 618,085.15 2,588,375.51 40° O'40.817 N 109° 23' 57.097 W
3,675.0 12.90 201.10 3,605.6 -627.7 -95.6 618,078.76 2,588,373.23 40° O'40.755 N 109° 23' 57.128 W
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Survey Report - Geographicf§eog resources
Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D
Project: Urntah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034 Oft(RKB Elev )
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034 Oft(RKB Elev )
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003 16 Single User Db

Survey

' Measured Vertical Map Map
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +N/-S +El-W Northing Easting

(ft) (°} (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

3,706.0 12.60 199.80 3,635.8 -634.1 -98.0 618,072.30 2,588,370.99 40° O'40.691 N 109° 23' 57.159 W
3,736.0 11.80 198.70 3,665.1 -640.1 -100.1 618,066.27 2,588,369.04 40° O'40.632 N 109° 23' 57.186 W
3,768.0 11.60 198.60 3,696.5 -646.2 -102.1 618,060.07 2,588,367.11 40° O'40.571 N 109° 23' 57.212 W
3,799.0 11.40 198.10 3,726.8 -652.1 -104.1 618,054.16 2,588,365.30 40° O'40.513 N 109° 23' 57.237 W
3,831.0 11.00 197.70 3,758.2 -658.0 -106.0 618,048.20 2,588,363.53 40° O' 40.455 N 109° 23' 57.262 W
3,863.0 11.20 197.10 3,789.6 -663.9 -107.8 618,042.28 2,588,361.83 40° O' 40.397 N 109° 23' 57.285 W
3,894.0 11.10 197.60 3,820.0 -669.6 -109.6 618,036.52 2,588,360.18 40° O' 40.340 N 109° 23' 57.308 W
3,925.0 10.50 196.30 3,850.5 -675.2 -111.3 618,030.93 2,588,358.61 40° 0' 40.285 N 109° 23' 57.330 W
3,957.0 9.80 194.90 3,882.0 -680.6 -112.8 618,025.46 2,588,357.22 40° O' 40.232 N 109° 23' 57.350 W
3,989.0 9.60 197.30 3,913.5 -685.8 -114.3 618,020.25 2,588,355.85 40° O' 40.180 N 109° 23' 57.369 W
4,019.0 9.60 201.60 3,943.1 -690.5 -116.0 618,015.50 2,588,354.30 40° O'40.134 N 109° 23' 57.390 W
4,051.0 9.30 202.70 3,974.7 -695.3 -118.0 618,010.58 2,588,352.43 40° O'40.086 N 109° 23' 57.416 W
4,081.0 8.80 201.90 4,004.3 -699.7 -119.8 618,006.18 2,588,350.74 40° O'40.043 N 109° 23' 57.439 W
4,113.0 8.40 200.50 4,035.9 -704.2 -121.5 618,001.68 2,588,349.12 40° O' 39.999 N 109° 23' 57.461 W
4,143.0 8.10 200.20 4,065.6 -708.2 -123.0 617,997.61 2,588,347.71 40° O' 39.959 N 109° 23' 57.480 W
4,175.0 7.70 198.70 4,097.3 -712.4 -124.5 617,993.43 2,588,346.35 40° O' 39.918 N 109° 23' 57.499 W
4,207.0 7.30 197.40 4,129.1 -716.3 -125.8 617,989.43 2,588,345.14 40° O'39.878 N 109° 23' 57.516 W
4,239.0 7.00 196.80 4,160.8 -720.1 -126.9 617,985.59 2,588,344.06 40° O'39.841 N 109° 23' 57.531 W
4,269.0 6.90 196.50 4,190.6 -723.6 -128.0 617,982.09 2,588,343.10 40° O'39.806 N 109° 23' 57.544 W
4,301.0 6.50 198.30 4,222.4 -727.2 -129.1 617,978.51 2,588,342.07 40° O'39.771 N 109° 23' 57.559 W
4,332.0 6.10 201.40 4,253.2 -730.4 -130.2 617,975.28 2,588,341.00 40° O'39.740 N 109° 23' 57.573 W
4,363.0 5.60 202.00 4,284.0 -733.3 -131.4 617,972.32 2,588,339.90 40° O'39.711 N 109° 23' 57.588 W
4,395.0 5.10 200.40 4,315.9 -736.1 -132.5 617,969.51 2,588,338.88 40° O'39.683 N 109° 23' 57.602 W
4,425.0 4.60 201.00 4,345.8 -738.5 -133.4 617,967.12 2,588,338.04 40° O'39.660 N 109° 23' 57.614 W
4,457.0 3.80 205.60 4,377.7 -740.6 -134.3 617,964.94 2,588,337.18 40° O'39.638 N 109° 23' 57.626 W
4,487.0 2.90 207.60 4,407.6 -742.2 -135.1 617,963.36 2,588,336.43 40° O'39.623 N 109° 23' 57.636 W
4,519.0 2.40 207.60 4,439.6 -743.5 -135.8 617,962.03 2,588,335.78 40° O' 39.610 N 109° 23' 57.644 W
4,549.0 2.40 206.70 4,469.6 -744.6 -136.3 617,960.90 2,588,335.23 40° O' 39.599 N 109° 23' 57.652 W
4,581.0 2.40 207.60 4,501.6 -745.8 -136.9 617,959.69 2,588,334.65 40° O'39.587 N 109° 23' 57.660 W
4,613.0 2.10 203.60 4,533.5 -746.9 -137.5 617,958.55 2,588,334.13 40° O'39.576 N 109° 23' 57.667 W
4,643.0 1.50 206.20 4,563.5 -747.8 -137.9 617,957.68 2,588,333.76 40° O'39.567 N 109° 23' 57.672 W
4,675.0 1.10 176.60 4,595.5 -748.5 -138.0 617,957.00 2,588,333.61 40° O'39.561 N 109° 23' 57.674 W
4,680.4 1.07 170.85 4,600.9 -748.6 -138.0 617,956.90 2,588,333.62 40° O' 39.560 N 109° 23' 57.674 W
Wasatch #f544
4,705.0 1.10 143.50 4,625.5 -749.0 -137.9 617,956.48 2,588,333.81 40° O' 39.556 N 109° 23' 57.671 W
4,737.0 1.30 137.30 4,657.5 -749.5 -137.4 617,955.98 2,588,334.25 40° O' 39.550 N 109° 23' 57.666 W
4,768.0 1.00 144.20 4,688.5 -750.0 -137.0 617,955.51 2,588,334.65 40° O' 39.546 N 109° 23' 57.661 W
4,799.0 0.80 148.10 4,719.5 -750.4 -136.8 617,955.11 2,588,334.94 40° O' 39.542 N 109° 23' 57.657 W
4,831.0 0.70 145.10 4,751.5 -750.7 -136.5 617,954.77 2,588,335.17 40° O'39.538 N 109° 23' 57.654 W
4,862.0 0.30 102.90 4,782.5 -750.9 -136.3 617,954.60 2,588,335.37 40° O'39.537 N 109° 23' 57.652 W
4,924.0 0.40 17.40 4,844.5 -750.7 -136.1 617,954.78 2,588,335.58 40° O'39.538 N 109°23' 57.649 W
5,019.0 0.40 12.30 4,939.5 -750.1 -136.0 617,955.42 2,588,335.74 40° O' 39.545 N 109° 23' 57.647 W
5,112.0 0.30 5.20 5,032.5 -749.5 -135.9 617,955.98 2,588,335.82 40° O' 39.550 N 109° 23' 57.646 W
5,205.0 0.40 12.80 5,125.5 -749.0 -135.8 617,956.54 2,588,335.90 40° O' 39.556 N 109° 23' 57,645 W
5,297.0 0.30 205.90 5,217.5 -748.9 -135.8 617,956.64 2,588,335.86 40° O'39.557 N 109° 23' 57.645 W
S,390.0 0.60 183.60 5,310.5 -749.6 -135.9 617,955.93 2,588,335.74 40° O'39.550 N 109° 23' 57.647 W
5,485.0 0.70 180.00 5,405.5 -750.7 -136.0 617,954.85 2,588,335.74 40° O'39.539 N 109° 23' 57.647 W
5,579.0 1.00 181.30 5,499.5 -752.1 -136.0 617,953.46 2,588,335.75 40° O'39.525 N 109° 23' 57.647 W
5,673.0 0.60 163.40 5,593.4 -753.4 -135.9 617,952.17 2,588,335.90 40° O' 39.512 N 109° 23' 57.646 W
5,766.0 0.80 163.70 5,686.4 -754.4 -135.5 617,951.09 2,588,336.25 40° O' 39.502 N 109° 23' 57.642 W
5,861.0 0.80 161.80 5,781.4 -755.7 -135.1 617,949.83 2,588,336.67 40° 0' 39.489 N 109° 23' 57.637 W i
5,956.0 0.80 165.70 5,876.4 -757.0 -134.8 617,948.57 2,588,337.07 40° 0' 39.477 N 109° 23' 57.632 W i
6,049.0 0.30 102.40 5,969.4 -757.7 -134.4 617,947.90 2,588,337.49 40° O' 39.470 N 109° 23' 57.627 W i
6,144.0 0.50 119.80 6,064.4 -757.9 -133.8 617,947.65 2,588,338.10 40° O' 39.467 N 109° 23' 57.619 W
PERR R&O 139 jg (159 4 -75pg

-133.9 g17,94L 588138.g5 gg° ' 46g § 109°22' SLþ9 W
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Survey Report - Geographic
"

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034 Oft(RKB Elev )
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034 Oft(RKB Elev )
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003 16 Single User Db

Survey

Measured Vertical Map Map
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting

(II) (°) (°) (II) (ft) (ft) (II) (ft) Latitude Longitude
6,333.0 0.60 132.60 6,253.4 -759.1 -132.3 617,946.51 2,588,339.60 40° O'39.456 N 109° 23' 57.600 W
6,427.0 0.70 133.50 6,347.4 -759.8 -131.5 617,945.80 2,588,340.40 40° O'39.448 N 109° 23' 57.590 W
6,521.0 1.10 129.40 6,441.4 -760.8 -130.4 617,944.86 2,588,341.53 40° O'39.439 N 109° 23' 57.576 W
6,616.0 0.70 180.20 6,536.4 -762.0 -129.7 617,943.72 2,588,342.26 40° O' 39.427 N 109° 23' 57.567 W
6,708.0 0.90 174.60 6,628.4 -763.2 -129.6 617,942.44 2,588,342.36 40° O'39.415 N 109° 23' 57.566 W
6,802.0 0.70 162.60 6,722.4 -764.5 -129.4 617,941.16 2,588,342.63 40° O'39.402 N 109° 23' 57.563 W
6,896.0 0.80 170.50 6,816.3 -765.7 -129.1 617,939.97 2,588,342.94 40° O'39.390 N 109° 23' 57.559 W
6,991.0 0.90 179.80 6,911.3 -767.1 -129.0 617,938.57 2,588,343.08 40° O'39.376 N 109° 23' 57.558 W
7,000.0 0.86 179.20 6,920.3 -767.3 -129.0 617,938.44 2,588,343.09 40° O'39.375 N 109° 23' 57.558 W
Price River #1544
7,086.0 0.50 168.80 7,006.3 -768.3 -128.9 617,937.42 2,588,343.19 40° O'39.365 N 109° 23' 57.557 W
7,180.0 0.40 145.50 7,100.3 -768.9 -128.7 617,936.76 2,588,343.47 40° O'39.358 N 109° 23' 57.553 W
7,274.0 0.60 166.10 7,194.3 -769.7 -128.4 617,936.02 2,588,343.80 40° O'39.351 N 109° 23' 57.549 W
7,368.0 0.70 165.20 7,288.3 -770.7 -128.1 617,934.99 2,588,344.09 40° O' 39.341 N 109° 23' 57.546 W
7,462.0 0.90 167.50 7,382.3 -772.0 -127.8 617,933.72 2,588,344.42 40° O'39.328 N 109° 23' 57.542 W
7,558.0 1.20 164.50 7,478.3 -773.7 -127.3 617,932.03 2,588,344.89 40° O' 39.311 N 109° 23' 57.536 W
7,651.0 0.90 161.00 7,571.3 -775.3 -126.9 617,930.41 2,588,345.43 40° O' 39.295 N 109° 23' 57.530 W
7,746.0 1.10 161.60 7,666.3 -776.9 -126.3 617,928.85 2,588,346.00 40° O' 39.280 N 109° 23' 57.523 W
7,838.0 1.20 161.20 7,758.2 -778.7 -125.7 617,927.12 2,588,346.63 40° O'39.262 N 109° 23' 57.516 W
7,932.0 1.30 159.30 7,852.2 -780.6 -125.0 617,925.21 2,588,347.37 40° O'39.243 N 109° 23' 57.507 W
8,026.0 1.20 150.00 7,946.2 -782.4 -124.2 617,923.38 2,588,348.28 40° O'39.225 N 109° 23' 57.495 W
8,119.0 1.40 156.50 8,039.2 -784.3 -123.2 617,921.51 2,588,349.26 40° O'39.206 N 109° 23' 57.483 W
8,212.0 1.60 148.40 8,132.1 -786.5 -122.1 617,919.39 2,588,350.45 40° O' 39.185 N 109° 23' 57.469 W
8,306.0 1.10 133.20 8,226.1 -788.2 -120.7 617,917.69 2,588,351.83 40° O' 39.168 N 109° 23' 57.452 W
8,399.0 1.10 122.60 8,319.1 -789.3 -119.3 617,916.63 2,588,353.26 40° 0' 39.157 N 109° 23' 57.434 W
8,493.0 1.00 131.30 8,413.1 -790.3 -118.0 617,915.64 2,588,354.66 40° O' 39.147 N 109° 23' 57.416 W
8,589.0 1.00 136.50 8,509.1 -791.5 -116.8 617,914.50 2,588,355.89 40° O' 39.136 N 109° 23' 57.400 W
8,627.0 0.90 136.00 8,547.1 -791.9 -116.3 617,914.06 2,588,356.34 40° O' 39.131 N 109° 23' 57.395 W
8,681.0 0.90 126.00 8,601.1 -792.5 -115.7 617,913.52 2,588,356.99 40° O'39.126 N 109° 23' 57.387 W
8,774.0 1.40 128.90 8,694.0 -793.6 -114.2 617,912.41 2,588,358.49 40° O'39.114 N 109° 23' 57.368 W
8,868.0 1.10 127.90 8,788.0 -794.9 -112.6 617,911.18 2,588,360.13 40° O'39.102 N 109° 23' 57.347 W
8,963.0 1.30 142.10 8,883.0 -796.3 -111.2 617,909.80 2,588,361.54 40° O'39.088 N 109° 23' 57.329 W
9,057.0 1.30 149.40 8,977.0 -798.1 -110.0 617,908.07 2,588,362.78 40° O'39.070 N 109° 23' 57.314 W
9,151.0 1.70 130.30 9,070.9 -799.9 -108.4 617,906.29 2,588,364.43 40° O' 39.052 N 109° 23' 57.293 W
9,245.0 1.90 122.20 9,164.9 -801.6 -106.0 617,904.61 2,588,366.85 40° O'39.035 N 109° 23' 57.263 W
9,336.0 1.80 122.90 9,255.8 -803.2 -103.6 617,903.09 2,588,369.36 40° O'39.020 N 109° 23' 57.231 W
9,389.5 1.80 122.90 9,309.3 -804.1 -102.2 617,902.21 2,588,370.80 40° O'39.011 N 109° 23' 57.213 W
PBHL #1544
9,391.0 1.80 122.90 9,310.8 -804.1 -102.1 617,902.18 2,588,370.84 40° O'39.010 N 109° 23' 57.212 W
Projection to TD
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OOg FOSONF@@S
Survey Report - Geographic

Company: EOG Resources Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well CWU #1544-26D
Project: Uintah County Utah TVD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Site: Chapita Well Unit 1541- 1546-26D MD Reference: True #34 @5034.0ft (RKB Elev.)
Well: CWU #1544-26D North Reference: True
Weilbore: Wellbore #1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Design: Wellbore #1 Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db

Targets

Target Name
- hit/miss target Dip Angle Dip Dir. TVD +NI-S +El-W Northing Easting
- Shape (•) (•) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) Latitude Longitude

PBHL #1544 0.00 0.00 9,310.0 -792.6 -120.2 617,913.32 2,588,352.52 40° 0' 39.125 N 109° 23' 57.444 W
- actual wellpath misses target center by 21.4ft at 9389.5ft MD (9309.3 TVD, -804.1 N, -102.2 E)
- Point

Wasatch #1544 0.00 0.00 4,600.0 -792.6 -120.2 617,913.32 2,588,352.52 40° O'39.125 N 109° 23' 57.444 W
- actual wellpath misses target center by 47.5ft at 4680.4ft MD (4600.9 TVD, -748.6 N, -138.0 E)
- Point

Price River #1544 0.00 0.00 6,920.0 -792.6 -120.2 617,913.32 2,588,352.52 40° O' 39.125 N 109° 23' 57.444 W
- actual wellpath misses target center by 26.8ft at 7000.0ft MD (6920.3 TVD, -767.3 N, -129.0 E)
- Circle (radius 50.0)

Design Annota ons

2,213.0 2,173.1 -352.1 -38.7 Tie into Surface Hole surveys
9,391.0 9,310.8 -804.1 -102.1 Projection to TD

Checked By: Approved By: Date:
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