
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

  
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME and NUMBER

BW 15-18-7-22 

2. TYPE OF WORK

DRILL NEW WELL     REENTER P&A WELL     DEEPEN WELL  
3. FIELD OR WILDCAT

UNDESIGNATED  

4. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well             Coalbed Methane Well: NO 

5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
 

6. NAME OF OPERATOR
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 

7. OPERATOR PHONE
303 308-3068 

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR
11002 East 17500 South, Vernal, Ut, 84078 

9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
debbie.stanberry@questar.com 

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER
(FEDERAL, INDIAN, OR STATE)

UTU71416 

11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP

FEDERAL    INDIAN    STATE    FEE  
12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP

FEDERAL    INDIAN    STATE    FEE  

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee')
  

14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')

 

18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

YES  (Submit Commingling Application)    NO  

19. SLANT
  

VERTICAL   DIRECTIONAL   HORIZONTAL  

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 626 FSL   1841 FEL SWSE 18 7.0 S 22.0 E S 

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 626 FSL   1841 FEL SWSE 18 7.0 S 22.0 E S 

At Total Depth 626 FSL   1841 FEL SWSE 18 7.0 S 22.0 E S 

21. COUNTY
UINTAH  

22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet)
626 

23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
2237 

 
 

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL
(Applied For Drilling or Completed)

0 

26. PROPOSED DEPTH
MD: 12570     TVD: 12570 

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL

5151 

28. BOND NUMBER

ESB000024 

29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

A36125 - 49-2153 

ATTACHMENTS
 

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES
 

 WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER  COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY

DRILLED)

TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

NAME Jan Nelson TITLE Permit Agent PHONE 435 781-4331 

SIGNATURE DATE 07/26/2010 EMAIL jan.nelson@questar.com 

API NUMBER ASSIGNED

    43047511790000

    
Permit Manager 

APPROVAL

FORM 3

AMENDED REPORT

API Well No: 43047511790000     Received: 7/26/2010

CONFIDENTIAL

API Well No: 43047511790000 Received: 7/26/2010

FORM 3
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME and NUWM15
8-7-22

2. TYPE OF WORK 3. FIELD OR WILDCAT
DRILL NEW WELL REENTER P&A WELL DEEPEN WELL UNDESIGNATED

4. TYPE OF WELL 5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
Gas Well Coalbed Methane Well: NO

6. NAME OF OPERATOR 7. OPERATOR PHONE
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 303 308-3068

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
11002 East 17500 South, Vernal, Ut, 84078 debbie.stanberry@questar.com

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER 11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP 12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
(FEDERAL, INDIAN, OR STU

4 6 FEDERALI ) INDIAN I ) STATE I I FEE FEDERAL INDIAN STATE I FEE I

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME 18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM 19. SLANT

(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

YES I I (Submit Commingling Application) NO I, I VERTICALI DIRECTIONAL I HORIZONTAL

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 626 FSL 1841 FEL SWSE 18 7.0 S 22.0 E S

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 626 FSL 1841 FEL SWSE 18 7.0 S 22.0 E S

At Total Depth 626 FSL 1841 FEL SWSE 18 7.0 S 22.0 E S

21. COUNTY 22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet) 23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
UINTAH 626 2237

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL 26. PROPOSED DEPTH(Applied For Drilling or Completed) MD: 12570 TVD: 12570
0

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL 28. BOND NUMBER 29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

5151 ESBOOOO24 A36125 -49-2153

ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP
DRILLED)

NAME lan Nelson TITLE Permit Agent PHONE 435 781-4331

SIGNATURE DATE 07/26/2010 EMAIL jan.nelson@questar.com

API NUMBER ASSIGNED APPROVAL

43047511790000

Permit

API Well No: 43047511790000 Received: 7/26/2010

I-ORM 3
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME and NUWM15
8-7-22

2. TYPE OF WORK 3. FIELD OR WILDCAT
DRILL NEW WELL REENTER P&A WELL DEEPEN WELL UNDESIGNATED

4. TYPE OF WELL 5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
Gas Well Coalbed Methane Well: NO

6. NAME OF OPERATOR 7. OPERATOR PHONE
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 303 308-3068

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
11002 East 17500 South, Vernal, Ut, 84078 debbie.stanberry@questar.com

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER 11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP 12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
(FEDERAL,INDIAN,ORUSTU4E16

FEDERALI) INDIANI) STATEII FEE FEDERAL INDIAN STATE I FEE I

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME 18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM 19. SLANT

(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

YES ,I (Submit Commingling Application) NO I, I VERTICALI DIRECTIONAL I HORIZONTAL

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 626 FSL 1841 FEL SWSE 18 7.0 S 22.0 E S

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 626 FSL 1841 FEL SWSE 18 7.0 S 22.0 E S

At Total Depth 626 FSL 1841 FEL SWSE 18 7.0 S 22.0 E S

21. COUNTY 22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet) 23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
UINTAH 626 2237

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL 26. PROPOSED DEPTH
(Applied For Drilling or Completed) MD: 12570 TVD: 125700

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL 28. BOND NUMBER 29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

5151 ESBOOOO24 A36125 -49-2153

ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

DRILLED)

NAME Jan Nelson TITLE Permit Agent PHONE 435 781-4331

SIGNATURE DATE 07/26/2010 EMAIL jan.nelson@questar.com

API NUMBER ASSIGNED APPROVAL

43047511790000

Permit



Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)   

Surf 12.25 9.625 0 450   

Pipe Grade Length Weight    

 Grade J-55 ST&C 450 36.0    

       

API Well No: 43047511790000     Received: 7/26/2010

CONFIDENTIAL

API Well No: 43047511790000 Received: 7/26/2010

Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)

Surf 12.25 9.625 0 450

Pipe Grade Length Weight

Grade J-55 ST&C 450

API Well No: 43047511790000 Received: 7/26/2010

Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)

Surf 12.25 9.625 0 450

Pipe Grade Length Weight

Grade J-55 ST&C 450



Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)   

I1 8.75 7 0 6858   

Pipe Grade Length Weight    

 Grade P-110 LT&C 6858 26.0    

       

API Well No: 43047511790000     Received: 7/26/2010

CONFIDENTIAL

API Well No: 43047511790000 Received: 7/26/2010

Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)

Il 8.75 7 0 6858

Pipe Grade Length Weight

Grade P-ll0 LT&C 6858

API Well No: 43047511790000 Received: 7/26/2010

Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)

Il 8.75 7 0 6858

Pipe Grade Length Weight

Grade P-110 LT&C 6858



Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)   

Prod 6.125 4.5 0 12570   

Pipe Grade Length Weight    

 Grade P-110 LT&C 12570 15.1    

       

API Well No: 43047511790000     Received: 7/26/2010

CONFIDENTIAL

API Well No: 43047511790000 Received: 7/26/2010

Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)

Prod 6.125 4.5 0 12570

Pipe Grade Length Weight

Grade P-l l0 LT& C 12570

API Well No: 43047511790000 Received: 7/26/2010

Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)

Prod 6.125 4.5 0 12570

Pipe Grade Length Weight

Grade P-110 LT&C 12570



'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

Additional Operator Remarks

QEP Energy Company proposes to drill a well to 12, 570' to test the Mesa Verde Formation.
This well is being twinedon well location SUBW 15W-18-7-22. If productive, casing willbe
run and the well completed. If dry, the wellwillbe plugged and abandoned as per BLMand
State of Utah requirements"

Please see Onshore Order No. 1.

Please refer to QEP Energy Company Greater Deadman Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Please be advised that QEP Energy Company agrees to be responsible under the terms and
conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No.ESBOOOO24. The principal is QEP
Energy company via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

Additional Operator Remarks

QEP Energy Company proposes to drill a well to 12, 570' to test the Mesa Verde Formation.
This well is being twinedon well location SUBW 15W-18-7-22. If productive, casing willbe
run and the well completed. If dry, the wellwillbe plugged and abandoned as per BLMand
State of Utah requirements"

Please see Onshore Order No. 1.
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

BW 15-18-7-22 Drilling Prog
API: TBD
Summarized Drilling Procedure

1. Set and cement 40' of 14" conductor
2. Drill 12-1/4" hole with air to 450'.
3. RIH w/ 9-5/8" 36# J-55 surface casing to 450', cement same.
4. Weld 11" 5M 'A' section wellhead on 9-5/8" casing.
5. N/U and test 11" 5M BOPE
6. MU and RIH with 8-3/4" PDC and BHA.
7. Drill 8-3/4" hole to intermediate casing point at 6,858'.
8. PU and RIH with 7" 26# P-110 LTC casing. Cement same.
9. ND BOP, NU and test 7-1/16" 10M 'B' section.
10. NU and test 7-1/16" 10M BOPE
11. RIH with 6-1/8" PDC and BHA.
12. Drill cement and shoe track. Continue drilling to TD at 12,570'.
13. RIH with 4-1/2" 15.1# P-110 to TD. Cement same.
14. RDMO drilling
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil andGas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of theseconditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth
Uinta Surface
Green River 3,715'
Mahogany 4,063'
Wasatch 6,808'
Mesa Verde 10,063'
Sego 12,313'
Castlegate 12,463'
TD 12,570'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral llearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 6,808'
Gas Mesa Verde 10,063'
Gas Sego 12,313'
Gas Castlegate 12,463'

All fresh water and prospectively valuableminerals encountered duringdrillingwill be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determinecommercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected, samples will
be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be
obtained from Wonsits Valley water right # A36125 (whichwas filed on May 7, 1964,) or
Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined
by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before 1989 is not
depletingto the Upper Colorado River System, to supply fresh water for drillingpurposes.
All water resulting from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash
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DRILLING PROGRAM
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be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be
obtained from Wonsits Valley water right # A36125 (whichwas filed on May 7, 1964,) or
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

DRILLING PROGRAM

Battery Disposal Site; SWSE, Section 27, T78, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site;
SWNW, Section 12, T88, R21E.

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. A 13-5/8" or 11", as available, 5,000 psi double gate, and 5,000 psi annular BOP
(schematic included) from surface casing point to intermediatecasing point.

B. An 11" or 7-1/6", as available, 10,000 psi double gate, and 10,000 psi annular BOP
(schematic included) from intermediate casing point to total depth.

C. Functional test daily.

D. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psi/foot or 1500 psi, whichever is
greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed the
internal yield pressure of the casing.

E. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to the approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure of
casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 5M (intermediate) or a 10M (production)
system, individual components shall be operable as designed.

4. Casing Desian:

Hole Csg. Top Bottom Mud Wt Wt. Grade Thread Cond.
Size Size (MD) (MD) (ppg)

12-1/4" 9-5/8" sfc 450' N/A 36.0 J-55 STC New

8 3/4" 7" sfc 6,858' 9.5 26.0 P-110 LTC New

6-1/8" 4-1/2" sfc 12,570' 12.5 15.1 P-110 LTC New

Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile (min)

9-5/8" 36.0 lb. J-55 STC 2,020 psi 3,520 psi 394,000 lb.

7" 26 lb. P-110 LTC 6,230 psi 9,960 psi 693,000 lb.
4-1/2" 15.1 lb- P-110 LTC 14,350 psi 14,420 psi 406,000 lb.

MINIMUM DESIGN FACTORS:

COLLAPSE:
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DRILLING PROGRAM
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

DRILLING PROGRAM

BURST: 1.10
TENSION: 1.30

Area Fracture Gradient: 0.76 psilfoot
Maximum anticipated mud weight: 12.5ppg
Maximum surface treating pressure: 9,500 psi
Over pull margin (minimum): 100,000 lbs

5. Cementing Program

9-5/8" Surface: Surface - 450' (MD)
§luryy;0' - 450'. 170 sks (299 fŸ) Rockies LT cement + 0.25 lb/sk Kwik Seal + 0.125
lb/sk Poly-E-Flake. Slurry wt: 13.5 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.81 fÝ/sk,Slurry volume: 12-1/4"
hole + 100% excess.

7" Intermediate Casing: Surface - 6858' (MD)
Lead Slurry: (BSC' - 6,358'): 370 sks (1,332 ft3)Halliburton Light Premium cement +
3 lbm/sk Silicate Compacted + 0.25% WG-17 (Gelling Agent) + 4% Bentonite (Light
Weight Additive) + 0.6% Econolite (Light Wt Add). Slurry wt: 11.0 ppg, Slurry yield:
3.65 iŸ/sk, Slurry volume: 8-3/4" hole + 50% excess in open hole section.

Tail Slurry: (6,358' - 6,858'): 80 sks (121 fÝ)50/50 Poz Premium + 0.3% Halad (R)-
344 fluid loss + 0.2% Super CBL (Expander) + 0.3% HR-5 (Retarder) + 0.2% Halad-200
(Suspension Agent). Slurry wt: 13.5 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.68 fÝ/sk,Slurry volume: 8-3/4"
hole + 50% excess.

4-1/2" Production Casing: Surface -12,570' (MD)
Lead Slurry: (6,358' - TD): 490 sks (824 fŸ)50/50 Poz Premium + 0.5% Halad (R)-
344 (Fluid Loss) + 0.5% Halad (R)-413 (Fluid Loss) + 0.45% HR-5 (Retarder) + 0.2%
Super CBL (expander) + 4% Bentonite (Lt Wt Add) + 3 lbm/ak Silicalite Compacted (Lt
Wt Add) + 20% SSA-1 (Fluid Loss). Slurry Wt: 13.5 lbm/gal; Yield: 1.73 cuft/sk; Slurry
volume: 6-1/8" Hole + 40% excess.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log. A bond log will be run across
the zone of interest and across zones as required by the authorized officer to insure
protection of natural resources.

6. Auxiliary Eauioment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - yes

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually and/or PVT/Flow Show

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor -



'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

DRILLING PROGRAM

E. Rotating Head - yes

F. Request for Variance

Drilling surface hole with air:

A variance from 43 CFR 3160 Onshore Oil and Gas Order #2, Section III
Requirements, subsection E. Special Drilling Operations is requested for the
specific operation of drilling and setting surface casing on the subject well with a
truckmounted air rig. The variance from the following requirements of Order #2
is requested because surface casing depth for this well is 450 feet and high
pressures are not expected.

1. Properly lubricated and maintained rotating head - A divertersystem in place
of a rotating head. The diverter system forces the air and cutting returns to the
reserve pit and is used to drill the surface casing.

2. Blooie line discharge 100 feet from wellbore and securely anchored -- the
blooie line discharge for this operation will be located 50 to 70 feet from the
wellhead. This reduced length is necessary due to the smaller location size to
minimize surface disturbance.

3. Automatie igniter or continuous pilot light on blooie line - a diffuser will be
used rather than an automatic pilot/igniter. Water is injected into the compressed
air and eliminates the need for a pilot light and the need for dust suppression
equipment.

4. Compressors located in the opposite direction from the blooie line a
minimum of 100 feet from the wellbore - compressors located within 50 feet on
the opposite side of the wellbore from the blooie line and is equipped with a 1)
emergency kill switch on the driller's console, 2) pressure relief valves on the
compressors, 3) spark arrestors on the motors.

5. Kill Fluid to control well - In lieu of having mud products on location to kill the
well for an unanticipated kick, Questarwill kill the well with water contained in a
400 bbl tank on site. The 400 bbl water tank will also be storage for surface
casing cement water.

6. Deflector on the end of the blooie line - Questarwill mount a deflector unit at
the end of the blooie line for the purpose of changing the directionand velocity of
the air and cuttings flow into the reserve pit. Changing the velocity and direction
of the cuttings and air will preserve the pit liner. In the event the deflectorwashes
out dueto erosion caused by the sand blasting effect of the cuttings, there will be
no problem because the deflector is mounted on the very end of the blooie. A
washed out deflector will be easily replaced.

7. Flare Pit - there will be no need of a flare pit during the surface hole air drilling
operation because the blooie line is routed directlyto the reserve pit. When the
big rig arrives for the main drilling after setting surface casing, a flare box will be
installed and all flare lines will be routed to the flare
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DRILLING PROGRAM
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

DRILLING PROGRAM

G. All other operations and equipment for air/gas drilling shall meet specifications in
Onshore Order #2, Section III Requirements, subsection E. Special Drilling
Operations and Onshore Order #1.

Surface holewill be drilledwith air, air/mist,foam,or mud depending on hole conditions.
Intermediate and production holes will be drilled with water based drilling fluids
consisting primarily of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and
polymers. Maximumanticipated mud weight is 12.5 ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Showwill be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

7. Testing. Ioasing and coring urogram

A. Cores -- Possible

B. DST -none anticipated

C. Logging - Mud logging -- 450' to TD
GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density

D. Formation and Completion Interval: Lower Mesa Verde intervals, final
determinationof completion will be made throughlog analysis.
Stimulation - Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperaturesor pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 8,170 psi. Maximum
anticipated bottomhole temperatureis 220°
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DRILLING PROGRAM

6M BOP STACK

Rotating Head
Frowline

Spacer Spool

5M Annular

5M Double Ram

2" KIIILine 3"Choke Line

2"5M 2"SM 2"5M 3"SM 3"SM

5Mx 9 5/8"5M Casing Head

I
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DRILLING PROGRAM
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10MAnnular -/

10M Double Ram

10M Drilling Spool -- -

2" Kill 3" Choke

2" 2" 2" 3" 3"
Chec Manual Manual Manual HC
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10MSingle Ram

G.L

Mat BöaTd

10MSpacer Spool

5Mx 10M Multi-BowlHead

5Mx 9 5/8" SOW
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REMOTELYOPERATEDVALVE 3" 4 Ay

ADJUSTABLECHOKE

SEQUENCEOPTIONAL

ADJUSTABLECHONE &

I-410Mand15MChokeManifoMEquipmert-- Conigralionofchokesmayvary
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Modified3-16-10MPG
BW15-18-7-22

API#
ProposedWBD

UintaBasin
SWSESec. 18,T78,R22E,UintahCo,UT 14•Canductor@40'

LOCATION:626'FSL,1,841'FEL

12-1/4"OH
KB5,163'
GL5,151' 9 5/r 36#J-558TC@450'

83/4"OH

7"26#P-110LTCsetat6,858'

6-1/8'0H

4-1/2"15.1#P-110LTCsetat12,570'

TD
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
BW #15-18-7-22

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 18, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

ILOCATION STAKE

CORNER #5

PIT "D"

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHERLY

lEXiBTING ACCESS

PHOTO: VIEW OF EXISTING ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHWESTERLY

, Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATIONPHOTos |0301 10 ruo-ro
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 IMONTH DAY YEAR

. s i s. . (435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813 TAKENBY:S.H. | DRAWNBY:Z.L
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
BW #15-18-7-22

SECTION 18, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL,
UTAH ALONG U.S. HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 3.9 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF STATE HIGHWAY 45; EXIT RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY, THEN IN A SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN IN A SOUTHERLY
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 20.3 MILES ON STATE HIGHWAY 45 TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHWEST;
TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 7.2 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHWEST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.1 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHWEST;
TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 3.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHWEST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 300' TO THE PROPOSED
LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 34.5
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. FIGURE #1
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR ' what,

1}BW #15--18-·-7--22
CONSECTION 18, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. OfVER

.

626' FSL 41' FEL DITC ty

SCALE: 1" = 60' Sto J 50
DATE: 02-26-10

.

DRAWN BY: S.L.

/ re it is to
ppde located a min.

Teeof 100' from the
.

F¡If SlopeWell Head

Approx.

1 p

EL 62 7"
5 6(Bim. Pit)

. Sta

/ Romid Carn
/ as NeededC-2

.

EL 64.4
Sta. 0+0

.Otm. P t)

Existing
. E/ 5 .9

E 4J.1'

LINE TABLE
LINE DIRECTION LENGTH

L1 N89°57'24"W 25.08'

Elev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Stake = 5151.0 UINTAH ENGINEERING cic LAND SURVEYINGF/N/SHED GRADE ELEI/ A T LOC. STAKE = 5151.0 as so. zoo z..e • v.s..t. ut.» esova · (was>
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. FIGURE //2x-section TYPICALCROSS SECTION FORscale
BW #15-18-7-22

1" = 100', SECTION 18, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
DATE: 02-26-10

626' FSL 1841' FELDRAWN BY: S.L.

48' 150'

STA. J+50

10' 90' 48' 150'

LOCAT/ON STAKE S/ope = 1 1/2: 1

III

ST/I. 1+75

1 90 48 150'

148' TSO'

STA. 0+00

APPROX/MA7E ACREAGES
NOTE: EX/ST/NG ½ELL S/TE O/STURBANCE = ± 1.11J ACRES * NOTE·
Topsoil should not be PROPOSED WELLS/TE O/S7URBANCE = ± 0.933 ACRES F/LL QUANT/TY/NCLUDES
Stripped Below Finished P/PEL/NE D/S7URBANCE = ± 1.629 ACRES SX FOR COMPACT/0N
Grade on Substructure Area. TOTAL = ± J.675 ACRES

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = 10,710 Cu. Yds.
Topsoil & Pit Backfill = J, 420 Cu. Yds.(6") Topsoil Stripping = 750 Cu. Yds.
(1/2 Pit Vol.)(New Construction Only)
EXCESS UNBALANCE = 7290 Cu. Yds.Remaining Location = 1J.7JO Cu. Yds.
(After Interim Rehabilitation)

TOTAL CUT = 14,480 CU.YDS UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINGFILL = J,770 CU.YDS. se so. soo z.,« . vernal, assa asova• rass)
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. FIGURE g3
TYPICALRIG LAYOUT FOR

BW #15--18--7-22
SECTION18, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

626' FSL 1841' FEL

SCALE: 1" = 60'
DATE: 02-26--10
DRAWN BY: S.L. r
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85 So. 200 East * Vernal. Utah 84078 * (435)
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CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. I I
( FIGURE #4(

RECLAMATIONPLAN FOR
BW #15-18-7-22

SECTION 18, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. INI
626 FSL 1841' FEL ' O

No. 16131 0
SCALE: 1" = 60' .. og
DATE: 07-20-10 RO og
DRAWN BY: S.L. r

Production Tanks

Weß Head

RE-HABBED AREA UINTAH ENGINEERING &: LAND SURVEYING
85 So. ß00 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435)
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VERNAL 24.2 MI.

PROPOSED LOCATION:
BW #15-18-7-22
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E E
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PROPOSED LOCATION N BW #15-18-7-22
SECTION 18, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

626' FSL 1841' FEL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 03 01 1085 South 200 East Vernal. Utah 84078 M A P DAY TEAR(435) 189-1017 * FAX (435) 189-1813

SCALE:1:100,000DRAWNBY:Z.L REVISED.
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BW #15-18-7-22
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SCALE:1"= 2000' DRAWNBY:Z.L ISED:
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PRODUCING WELLS ABANDONED WELLS SE CT lON 18, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.& M.
SHUT IN WELLS TEMPORARILY ABANDONED 626' FSL 1841'
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
REFERENCE MAP AREA OF VEGETATION

BW #15-18-7-22
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 18, T78, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

NOTE:
BEGINNING OF REFERENCE AREA
UTM NORTHING: 14806.198
UTM EASTING: 20046.23
LATITUDE: 40.206604288
LONGITUDE: -109.480719811

END OF REFERENCE AREA
UTM NORTHING: 14606.176
UTM EASTING: 20048.22
LATITUDE: 40.206434723
LONGITUDE: ·109.480008024

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF REFERENCE AREA

\.
. \ PROPOSED LOCATION:

,l BW #15-18-7-22

BEGINNING OF
REFERENCE AREA EXI TING

ND OF REFERENCE AREA

I

i Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying SCAIÆ:1"=soo, 07 20 10
85 South 200 East Vemal, Utah 84078 oma na un REE

- nue, , (435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813 TAKENBY:M.A. DRAWNBY:Z.L.
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An onsite inspection was conducted for the BW 15-18-722 on July 13, 2010. Weather conditions 
were sunny and warm at the time of the onsite.  In attendance at the inspection were the following individauls:

Kevin Sadlier Bureau of Land Management
James Hereford Bureau of Land Management
Holly Villa Bureau of Land Management
Jan Nelson Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
Guy Betts Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
Bob Haygood Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
Stephanie Tomkinson Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
Dee Christensen Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
McCoy Anderson Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying

1.     Existing Roads:

       The proposed well site is approximately 9 miles from Red Wash, UT 

        Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 – mile radius.

All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all  phases of operation.

2.     Planned Access Roads:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench 
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

         Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

No new access road is proposed.  The access to be used is the access to the existing SUBW 15W-18-7-22 
location. Graveling or capping the roadbed will be preformed as necessary to provide a well constructed safe road.

3.     Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 – Mile Radius:

        Please refer to Topo Map C.

4.     Location of Existing & Proposed Facilities:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench 
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

         Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.

              No new right-of-way will be required for the proposed pipeline. The pipeline will tie into the same 
existing right-of-way UTU-79059. The pipeline will be a surface,  6" or smaller. It will be strung along 
right-of-way and welded in place. The pipeline will be buired across County Road #  3220. 
QEP will obtain Uintah County road cut permit before any construction takes place.

It was determined on the onsite by the BLM VFO AO that the facilities will be painted Covert Green.

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI – POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

BW 15-18-7-22

SWSE, SECTION 18, T7S, R22E
                                                                             626' FSL 1841' FEL

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-71416

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'
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'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

BW 15-18-7-22
626' FSL 1841' FEL

SWSE, SECTION 18, T7S, R22E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

LEASE # UTU-71416

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI - POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN
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Holly Villa Bureau of Land Management
Jan Nelson Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
Guy Betts Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
Bob Haygood Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
Stephanie Tomkinson Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
Dee Christensen Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
McCoy Anderson Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying

1. Existinq Roads:

The proposed well site is approximately 9 miles from Red Wash, UT

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 - mile radius.

All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all phases of operation.

2. Planned Access Roads:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

No new access road is proposed. The access to be used is the access to the existing SUBW 15W-18-7-22
location. Graveling or capping the roadbed will be preformed as necessary to provide a well constructed safe road.

3. Location of Existinq Wells Within a 1 - Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.

4. Location of Existinq & Proposed Facilities:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.

No new right-of-way will be required for the proposed pipeline. The pipeline will tie into the same
existing right-of-way UTU-79059. The pipeline will be a surface, 6" or smaller. It will be strung along
right-of-way and welded in place. The pipeline will be buired across County Road # 3220.
QEP will obtain Uintah County road cut permit before any construction takes place.

It was determined on the onsite by the BLM VFO AO that the facilities will be painted Covert
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5.     Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench 
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Water for drilling purposes would be obtained from Wonsits Valley Water Right # A 36125 (which
was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash Water Right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960).
It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before 1989 is 
not depleting to the Upper Colorado River System.

6.     Source of Construction Materials:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench 
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

7.     Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench 
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

8.     Ancillary Facilities:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench 
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

9.     Well Site Layout:  (See Location Layout Diagram)

        The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills
        and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailer parking, spoil dirt 
        stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads.

A pit liner is required.  A felt pit liner will be required if bedrock is encountered.

10.    Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Uinta Basin Division Reclamation Plan

Site Specific Reclamation Summary:
Reclamation will follow Questar Exploration and Production Company, Uinta Basin Division's Reclamation Plan,
September 2009 (Questar's Reclamation Plan) and the BLM Green River District Reclamation Guidelines.
All trash and debris will be removed from the disturbed area.
The disturbed area will be backfilled with subsoil.
Topsoil will be spread to an even, appropriate depth and disced if needed.
Water courses and drainages will be restored.
Erosion control devices will be installed where needed.
Seeding will be done in the fall, prior to ground freeze up.
Seed mix will be submitted to a BLM AO for approval prior to seeding.
Monitoring and reporting will be conducted as stated in Questar's Reclamation Plan. A reference site has been
establised and is included in this application.

It was determined and agreed upon that there is 6" inches of top soil.

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

CONFIDENTIAL

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

5. Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Water for drilling purposes would be obtained from Wonsits Valley Water Right # A 36125 (which
was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash Water Right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960).
It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before 1989 is
not depleting to the Upper Colorado River System.

6. Source of Construction Materials:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

7. Methods of Handlinq Waste Materials:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

9. Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills
and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailerparking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads.

A pit liner is required. A felt pit liner will be required if bedrock is encountered.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Uinta Basin Division Reclamation Plan

Site Specific Reclamation Summary:
Reclamation will follow Questar Exploration and Production Company, Uinta Basin Division's Reclamation Plan,
September 2009 (Questar's Reclamation Plan) and the BLM Green River District Reclamation Guidelines.
All trash and debris will be removed from the disturbed area.
The disturbed area will be backfilled with subsoil.
Topsoil will be spread to an even, appropriate depth and disced if needed.
Water courses and drainages will be restored.
Erosion control devices will be installed where needed.
Seeding will be done in the fall, prior to ground freeze up.
Seed mix will be submitted to a BLM AO for approval prior to seeding.
Monitoring and reporting will be conducted as stated in Questar's Reclamation Plan. A reference site has been
establised and is included in this application.

It was determined and agreed upon that there is 6" inches of top

'APIWellNo:43047511790000'

5. Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

Water for drilling purposes would be obtained from Wonsits Valley Water Right # A 36125 (which
was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash Water Right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960).
It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before 1989 is
not depleting to the Upper Colorado River System.

6. Source of Construction Materials:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

7. Methods of Handlinq Waste Materials:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Greater Deadmen Bench
EIS UT-080-2003-0369V Record of Decision dated March 31, 2008.

9. Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills
and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailerparking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads.

A pit liner is required. A felt pit liner will be required if bedrock is encountered.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please refer to Questar Exploration & Production Company Uinta Basin Division Reclamation Plan

Site Specific Reclamation Summary:
Reclamation will follow Questar Exploration and Production Company, Uinta Basin Division's Reclamation Plan,
September 2009 (Questar's Reclamation Plan) and the BLM Green River District Reclamation Guidelines.
All trash and debris will be removed from the disturbed area.
The disturbed area will be backfilled with subsoil.
Topsoil will be spread to an even, appropriate depth and disced if needed.
Water courses and drainages will be restored.
Erosion control devices will be installed where needed.
Seeding will be done in the fall, prior to ground freeze up.
Seed mix will be submitted to a BLM AO for approval prior to seeding.
Monitoring and reporting will be conducted as stated in Questar's Reclamation Plan. A reference site has been
establised and is included in this application.

It was determined and agreed upon that there is 6" inches of top



11.    Surface Ownership:
Bureau of Land Management

                   170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah  84078

        (435) 781-4400

12.    Other Information

        A Class III archaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology Consultants.
        A copy of this report was submitted on April 15, 2010, Moac Report No. 10-026 by
        Montgomery Archaeology Consultants.  Cultural resource clearance was recommended 
        for this location.

A Class lll paleontological survey was conducted by Intermountain Paleo Consulting. A copy of 
this report was submitted on March 23, 2010, IPC # 10-14 by Stephen D. Sandau. 
The inspection resulted in little to no signs of fossils. Therefore, we recommend that no paleontological
restrictions should be placed on the development of the projects included in this report. However, if
vertebrate fossils are found during construction a paleontologist should be immediately notified.
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Lessee's or Operator's Representative & Certification:

Jan Nelson
Permit Agent
QEP Energy Company
11002 East 17500 South
Vernal, UT 84078
(435) 781-4331

Certification:AIIlease and/or unit operations willbe conducted in such a manner that full
compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders,
the approved Plan of Operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

The Operator willbe fully responsible for the actions of its subcontractors. A complete
copy of the approved "Application for Permit to Drill"will be furnished to the field
representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all construction
and drilling operations.

QEP Energy Company is considered to be the operator of the subject well.
QEP Energy Company agrees to be responsible under termsand conditions
of the lease for the operations conducted upon leased lands.

Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104.2 for lease activities is being provided by
Bond No. ESBOOOO24

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site and access route, that I am familiarwith the conditions that currently exist; that I have
full knowledge of the State and Federal laws applicable to this operations; that the
statements made in thisplan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and the
work associated with the operations proposed herein willbe performed in conformity
with this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. This statement
is subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filingof a false statement.

7/26/2010
Jan Nelson Date
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WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 7/26/2010 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43047511790000

WELL NAME: BW 15-18-7-22   

OPERATOR: QEP ENERGY COMPANY (N3700) PHONE NUMBER: 435 781-4331

CONTACT: Jan Nelson   

PROPOSED LOCATION: SWSE 18 070S 220E Permit Tech Review:

SURFACE: 0626 FSL 1841 FEL Engineering Review:

BOTTOM: 0626 FSL 1841 FEL Geology Review:

COUNTY: UINTAH 

LATITUDE: 40.20595 LONGITUDE: -109.47925

UTM SURF EASTINGS: 629426.00 NORTHINGS: 4451514.00

FIELD NAME: UNDESIGNATED   

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal   

LEASE NUMBER: UTU71416             PROPOSED PRODUCING FORMATION(S): MESA VERDE 

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE: NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

PLAT R649-2-3.

Bond: FEDERAL - ESB000024      Unit:  

Potash R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5      

Oil Shale 190-3 R649-3-3. Exception

Oil Shale 190-13  Drilling Unit 

Water Permit: A36125 - 49-2153           Board Cause No:  R649-3-2

RDCC Review:           Effective Date:  

Fee Surface Agreement           Siting:  

Intent to Commingle R649-3-11. Directional Drill

 Commingling Approved  

Comments:          Presite Completed
                  

Stipulations:         4 - Federal Approval - dmason
                             23 - Spacing - dmason

CONFIDENTIAL

WORKSHEET
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Permit To Drill

******************
Well Name:  BW 15-18-7-22

API Well Number:  43047511790000

Lease Number:  UTU71416

Surface Owner:   FEDERAL 

Approval Date:  8/2/2010

Issued to:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY, 11002 East 17500 South, Vernal, Ut 84078

Authority:
Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. §40-6-1 et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit to drill the listed
well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of R649-3-2. The expected producing
formation or pool is the MESA VERDE Formation(s), completion into any other zones will require
filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool will require
approval in accordance with R649-3-22.

Duration:
This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous operation
is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date

General:
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to drill.

Conditions of Approval:
State approval of this well does not supercede the required federal approval, which must be obtained
prior to drilling. 

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have not been
established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”). In order to avoid the
possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is requested, once the well has been
drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze geological and engineering data generated
therefrom, as well as any similar data from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable
after completion of its analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter
section upon which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an
appropriate order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board. 

Notification Requirements:
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following actions during
drilling of this well:
   • Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well – contact Carol Daniels at 801-538-5284
     (please leave a voicemail message if not available)
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State of Utah
, DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
"- MICHAELR.STYLER

GAR . H HERT Excutiw Drotor

comrwr Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BA2A
Lieuterard Gowrver Dusion Dmctor
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Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22
API Well Number: 43047511790000

Lease Number: UTU71416
Surface Owner: FEDERAL
Approval Date: 8/2/2010

Issued to:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY, l1002 East 17500 South, Vernal, Ut 84078

Authority:
Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. §40-6-1et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit to drill the listed
well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of R649-3-2. The expected producing
formation or pool is the MESA VERDE Formation(s), completion into any other zones will require
filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool will require
approval in accordance with R649-3-22.

Duration:
This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous operation
is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date

General:
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to drill.

Conditions of Approval:
State approval of this well does not supercede the required federal approval, which must be obtained
prior to drilling.

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have not been
established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board"). In order to avoid the
possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is requested, once the well has been
drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze geological and engineering data generated
therefrom, as well as any similar data from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable
after completion of its analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter
section upon which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an
appropriate order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

Notification Requirements:
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following actions during
drilling of this well:

• Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well - contact Carol Daniels at 801-538-5284
(please leave a voicemail message if not
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

'- MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT Excutiw Drotor

comrwr Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BA2A
Lieuterard Gowrver Dusion Dmctor
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API Well Number: 43047511790000

Lease Number: UTU71416
Surface Owner: FEDERAL
Approval Date: 8/2/2010

Issued to:
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filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool will require
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Duration:
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is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date
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Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to drill.

Conditions of Approval:
State approval of this well does not supercede the required federal approval, which must be obtained
prior to drilling.

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have not been
established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board"). In order to avoid the
possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is requested, once the well has been
drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze geological and engineering data generated
therefrom, as well as any similar data from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable
after completion of its analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter
section upon which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an
appropriate order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

Notification Requirements:
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following actions during
drilling of this well:

• Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well - contact Carol Daniels at 801-538-5284
(please leave a voicemail message if not



     OR
     submit an electronic sundry notice (pre-registration required) via the Utah Oil & Gas website
     at https://oilgas.ogm.utah.gov

Reporting Requirements:
All reports, forms and submittals as required by the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
will be promptly filed with the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, including but not limited to:
   • Entity Action Form (Form 6) – due within 5 days of spudding the well
   • Monthly Status Report (Form 9) – due by 5th day of the following calendar month
   • Requests to Change Plans (Form 9) – due prior to implementation
   • Written Notice of Emergency Changes (Form 9) – due within 5 days
   • Notice of Operations Suspension or Resumption (Form 9) – due prior to implementation
   • Report of Water Encountered (Form 7) – due within 30 days after completion
   • Well Completion Report (Form 8) – due within 30 days after completion or plugging

Approved By:

Acting Associate Director, Oil & Gas 

API Well No: 43047511790000API Well No: 43047511790000

OR
submit an electronic sundry notice (pre-registration required) via the Utah Oil & Gas website
at https://oilgas.ogm.utah.gov

Reporting Requirements:
All reports, forms and submittals as required by the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
will be promptly filed with the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, including but not limited to:

• Entity Action Form (Form 6) - due within 5 days of spudding the well
• Monthly Status Report (Form 9) - due by 5th day of the following calendar month
• Requests to Change Plans (Form 9) - due prior to implementation
• Written Notice of Emergency Changes (Form 9) - due within 5 days
• Notice of Operations Suspension or Resumption (Form 9) - due prior to implementation
• Report of Water Encountered (Form 7) - due within 30 days after completion
• Well Completion Report (Form 8) - due within 30 days after completion or plugging

Approved By:

Acting Associate Director, Oil &
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Approved By:

Acting Associate Director, Oil &



RECElVEDFonn3160-3
FORMAPPROVED(August2007)
0MBNo 1004-0137

ExpiresJuly31,2010UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, 5. LeaseserialNo.
BUREAUOFLAND MANAGEMENT UTU71416

6. IfIndian,Alloteeor TribeNameAPPLICATION FOR PERMITTODRILLORREENTER

la. Typeof work: DRILL REENTER 2 IfUnitor CAAgreement,NameandNo.

8. LeaseNameandWellNo,Ib. TypeofWell: O08 wen Ga WenQM OSingleZone MultipleZone BW 15-18-7-221 Nameof OperatorQEP ENERGY COMPANY CONTACT: JAN NELSON 9. API WellNo.43 DTI e n?3a. Address11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH 3b. PhoneNopmudearea ade) 10 Fieldand Pool,orExploratoryVERNAL,UT 84078 435-781-4331
UNDESIGNATED4. LocationofWell(Reportlocanonclearly and in aconfere withmystaterequiremena.*) 11.Sec.,T.R.M. or Blk.andSurveyorAreaAtsurface SWSE 626 FSL 1841 FEL40.20594 N LAT, 109.47997 W LON SEC. 18, T78, R22E MER SLBAt proposedprod.zone SWSE 626 FSL 1841 FEL 40.20594 N LAT,109.47997 W LON

14.Distancein miles anddirectionfromnearesttownor postoffice* 12.Countyor Parish 13.StateAPPROXIMATELY9 MILES FROM RED WASH, UT, UINTAH UT15. Distanceimmproposd*
626 16 No.of acmsinJease 17.SpacingUnitdedicatedtothiswelllocationtonearest

propertyor leaseline,ft 2237.00 40.00(Alsotonearestdrig,unitline,if any)
18.DistancefrompLoosedlocation*

25 19 ProposedDepth 20. BLM/BIABond No.onfileppnledstor
o this

li , completed'
12570 MD ESBOOOO24

21. Elevations(ShowwhetherDF,KDB,RT,GL,etc.) 21 Approximatedateworkwillstart* 21 Estimatedduration5151 GL
10/01/2010 45
24. Attachments

Thefollowing,completedinaccordancewhhtherequirementsofOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,mustbeattachedtothisfemt
1. Wellplatcertifiedbya registeredsurveyor. 4. Bondtocoverthe operationsunlesscoveredby anexistingbondon file(see1 ADrillingPlan. Item20above).3. A SurfaceUsePlan(if the locationis on National ForestSystemLands,the 5. OperatorcertificationSUPO mustbe f withtheappropriateForestServiceOffice). 6. Suchothersitespecificinformationand/orplansas maybemquiredbytheBLM.

25. Signature Name(Printed/Typed) DateJAN NELSON 07/22/2010Title

dattfWR Sparger °10 I 26
Title Office

VERNALFIELDOFFICEApplicationapprovaltioesnotwa ifythat
iIdslegalorequitabletitletothoserightsinthesubjectleasewhichwouldentitletheapplicanttoconductoperationsthereon. NSOFAPPROVALATTACHEDConditionsof approval,ifany,areattached.

Title18U.S.C.Secdon1001andTide43 U.S.C.Section1212,makeits crimeforanypersonknowinIy and willfullytomaketoanydepartmentor agencyofthe UnitedStatesanyfalse,fictitiousof fraudulentstatementsor representationsas toanymatterwithinitsjuri iction.
(Continued on page 2)
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UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4401

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: QEP Energy Company Location: SWSE, Sec. 18, T7S, R22E
Well No: BW 15-18-7-22 Lease No: UTU-71416
API No: 43-047-51179 Agreement: N/A

OFFICE NUMBER: (435) 781-4400

OFFICE FAX NUMBER: (435) 781-3420

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with the
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill including
Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible for the actions
of his subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD must be on location during construction, drilling, and
completion operations. This permit is approved for a two (2) year period, or until lease expiration,
whichever occurs first. An additional extension, up to two (2) years, may be applied for by sundry
notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and
(Notify Environmental Scientist) access roads.

Location Completion - Prior to moving on the drilling rig.
(Notify Environmental Scientist)

Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notify Petroleum Engineer)

Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.) cementing all casing strings to: ut vn opreport@blm.gov.

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.)

First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify Petroleum Engineer) production resumes after well has been off production for

more than ninety (90)
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Well: BW 15-18-7-22

11/18/2010

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

• All new and replacement internal combustion gas field engines of less than or equal to 300 design-
rated horsepower must not emit more than 2 gms of NOx per horsepower-hour. This requirement
does not apply to gas field engines of less than or equal to 40 design-rated horsepower.

• All and replacement internal combustion gas field engines of greater than 300 design rated
horsepower must not emit more than 1.0 gms of NOx per horsepower-hour.

• If there is an active Gilsonite mining operation within 2 miles of the well location, operator shall
notify the Gilsonite operator at least 48 hours prior to any blasting during construction.

• If paleontological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop
work and contact the Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will be made by the AO as to what
mitigation may be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material before construction can
continue.

SITE SPECIFIC COAs:
Company/Operator: QEP Energy Company
Well Name & Number: BW 15-18-7-22
Surface Ownership: BLM
Lease Number: UTU-71416
Onsite Date: 7/13/2010
Location: SW/SE Section 18, Ï7S R22E
Date sundry Received: 8/0 l /2010

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL:
• This project will be implemented on or after the sundry approval date. If the well has not been

spudded by March 31, 2013 this sundry will expire and the operator is to cease all operations related
to preparing to drill the well.

• During operations, if any vertebrate paleontological resources are discovered, all operations
affecting such sites shall be immediately suspended, and all discoveries shall be left intact until
authorized to proceed by the Authorized Officer. The appropriate Authorized Officer of the Vernal
BLM office shall be notified within 48 his of the discovery, and a decision as to the preferred
alternative course of action will be rendered.

• Prior to construction, an invasive plants/noxious weeds inventory will be completed for all areas
where surface disturbance will occur, and a completed Weed Inventory Form will be submitted to
the BLM Authorized Officer.

Reclamation
• Reclamation will be completed in accordance with the QuestarExploration and Production

Company, Uintah Basin Division's Reclamation Plan on file with the Vernal Field Office of the
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• The operator shall submit a Sundry Notice (Form 3160-5) to the BLM Authorized Officer (AO) 3
growing seasons after reclamation efforts have occurred evaluating the status of the reclaimed areas
in order to determine whether the BEM standards set forth in the Green River District Reclamation
Guidelines have been met (30% or greater basal cover).

Downhole specific COAs
• All requirements for drilling operations in Onshore Order #2 shall be adhered to.

• Advance 24 hour notification through UT VN OpReport@blm.gov is required for BOPE tests.
Operator shall provide notification prior to installing/testing BOPE for the 5M BOPE system. For
the e-mail notification, please place in the e-mail notification subject line the following text,
"Deepening well work, BOPE test for 5M
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DOWNHOLE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE COAs:

Variances Granted:

Air Drilling:

1. Variance requests, listed in Section 6 F of your drilling plan, are approved.

All provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly adhered
to. The following items are emphasized:

DRILLINGICOMPLETION/PRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

• The spud date and time shall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of spudding.

• Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least 24 hours in
advance of casing cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure tests.

• All requirements listed in Onshore Order #2 III. E. Special Drilling Operations are applicable for air
drilling of surface hole.

• Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use until the well is completed or abandoned.
Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times. Choke manifolds
shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

• All BOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the daily
drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order
No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be performed by a
test pump with a chart recorder and NOT by the rig pumps. Test shall be reported in the driller's
log.

• BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from
under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

• Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and cemented
in place.

• No aggressive/fresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

• Cement baskets shall not be run on surface casing.

• The operator must report all shows of water or water-bearing sands to the BLM. If flowing water is
encountered it must be sampled, analyzed, and a copy of the analyses submitted to the BLM Vernal
Field
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• The operator must report encounters of all non oil & gas mineral resources (such as Gilsonite, tar
sands, oil shale, trona, etc.) to the Vernal Field Office, in writing, within 5 working days of each
encounter. Each report shall include the well name/number, well location, date and depth (from KB
or GL) of encounter, vertical footage of the encounter and, the name of the person making the report
(along with a telephone number) should the BLM need to obtain additional information.

• A complete set of angular deviation and directional surveys of a directional well will be submitted to
the Vernal BLM office engineer within 30 days of the completion of the well.

• While actively drilling, chronologic drilling progress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM,
Vernal Field Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers
until the well is completed.

• A cement bond log (CBL) will be ruti from the production casing shoe to the top of cement and shall
be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of the CBL
to this office.

• Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for submittal of
paper logs to the BLM.

• There shall be no deviation from tlie proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Any changes in operation must
have prior approval from the BLM Vernal Field
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OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

• All wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator, lease serial
number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

• In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "Monthly Report of
Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which operations
commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and abandoned. This report
shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver,
Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-3650 for reporting information.

• Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLM Vernal Field office must be
notified when it is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be by written communication
and must be received in this office by not later than the fifth business day following the date on
which the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a minimum, the following
informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephone number.

o Well name and number.

o Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royalty will be
paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise the
non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.

• All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will be
reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A, shall be reported
verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than Major Events"
will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on the Monthly Report
of Operations and
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• Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and Recompletion
Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days after completion of
the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1.
Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled
during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be filed on BLM Form 3160-4.
Submit with the well completion report a,geologic report including, at a minimum, formation tops,
and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys, sample descriptions, strip logs,
core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid,
and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the BLM, Vernal Field Office.

• All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease, shall have prior
written approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.

• Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The BLM Vernal Field Office
Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all
future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be submitted to the
BLM Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the API standards for liquid
hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement. All measurement points shall be
identified as the point of sale or allocation for royalty purposes.

• A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted to
the BLM Vernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs
first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be adhered to.
All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively sealed in
accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3.

• Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filing of a
suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office. Emergency approval may be
obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

• No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior approval of
the BLM Vernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30 days, prior
approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office shall be obtained and notification given before resumption
of operations.

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No.. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water produced
from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent disposal
method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day period. In
order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal method shall be
submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but no later than 45 days
after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not been approved prior to the
end of the authorized 90-day period will be considered as an Incident of Noncompliance and will be
grounds for issuing a shut-in order until ati acceptable manner for disposing of said water is provided
and approved by this
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• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or abandoned, all
pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent Report of
Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual plugging of
the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of casing left in
hole, and the current status of the surface
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API Well No: 43047511790000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU71416 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BW 15-18-7-22 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047511790000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UNDESIGNATED 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0626 FSL 1841 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSE Section: 18 Township: 07.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

12/15/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP ENERGY COMPANY REQUEST APPROVAL TO CHANGE THE 4.5"
PRODUCTION CASING WEIGHT AND GRADE FROM: 4.5" 13.5# N-80 LTC

COLLAPSE: 8,450 PSI BURST: 9,020 PSI TENSILE: 270,000 lbs (joint strength
constrained)TO: 4.5" 11.6# HCP-110 LTC COLLAPSE: 8,830 PSI BURST

10,710 PSI TENSILE: 279,000 lbs (joint strength constrained) IN ADDITION
QEP REQUEST A CHANGE IN BOPE REQUIREMENT FOR PRODUCTION HOLE:

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jan Nelson 435 781-4331

TITLE
 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/8/2010

December 08, 2010

12/09/2010

iPI Well No: 43047511790000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
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SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
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11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
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Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

12/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE
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TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL
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12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGY COMPANY REQUEST APPROVAL TO CHANGE THE 4.5"
PRODUCTION CASING WEIGHT AND GRADE FROM: 4.5" 13.5# N-80 LTC Accepted by the

COLLAPSE: 8,450 PSI BURST: 9,020 PSI TENSILE: 270,000 lbs (joint strength Utah Division of
constrained)TO: 4.5" 11.6# HCP-110 LTC COLLAPSE: 8,830 PSI BURST Oil, Gas and Mining

10,710 PSI TENSILE: 279,000 lbs (joint strength constrained) IN ADDITION
QEP REQUEST A CHANGE IN BOPE REQUIREMENT FOR PRODUCTION HOLBate: 12/09/2 0

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
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Change in BOPE requirement for production hole:

- Old Design: 7-1/ 16" 10M BOPE. BHP based on max anticipated MW of
12.5 ppg from offset wells. Initial calculations suggested that 7-1/ 16" 10M
BOPE would be required to drill the production segment of this hole.

- New Design: 11" 5M BOPE. BHP based on max anticipated MW of 11.8 ppgfrom offset wells (in the Mesa Verde) yielding a max BHP of 7,712 psi.
Further, pursuant to the standards and guidelines of Onshore Order #2,

using a pressure gradient of 0.22 psi/ft, max surface pressure would be
4,947 psi. A 5M BOPE system would satisfy these requirements. All BOPE
equipment will be tested in accordance with BLM Onshore Order #2.
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CONFllENTIAL
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: QEP ENERGY COMPANY

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22

Api No: 43-047-51179 Lease Type FEDERAL

Section 18 Township 07S Range 22E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor RIG #

SPUDDED:
Date 01/03/2011

Time NOON

How DRY

Drilling wi/I Commence:

Reported by DAVID

Telephone # (435) 828-0394

Date 01/04/2011 Signed

CONFllENTIAL
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: QEP ENERGY COMPANY

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22

Api No: 43-047-51179 Lease Type FEDERAL

Section 18 Township 07S Range 22E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor RIG #

SPUDDED:
Date 01/03/2011

Time NOON

How DRY

Drilling wi/I Commence:

Reported by DAVID

Telephone # (435) 828-0394

Date 01/04/2011 Signed



CONFilENR
STATE OF UTAH FORMe

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DlVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING & LEASEDESIGNATlONANDSERLALNUMBER:

UTU71416

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS ';FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

7. UNITor CA ÁGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals todrillnewwells,significantlydeepen existing wellsbelow cummt bottom-holedepth, reenterplugged weis,or t° KILIMANJARO UNITUTU88205Xdrillhorizontal laterals. UseAPPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL B. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER BW 15-18-7-22

1 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP ENERGYCOMPANY 4304751179
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, 0R WILDCAT:

11002 E.17500 S cm VERNAL STATE UT Z1P84078 (435) 781-4342 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFAce 626' FSL, 1841' FEL coUNTY: UINTAH

QTRIQTR,SECTION, TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERlDIAN:SWSE 18 7S 22E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTlCE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximatedeteworkwillstart: CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAlR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completiort

O COMMINGLEPRODUClNGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: SPUD SUNDRY
1/3/2011

CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENTFORMAT10N

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details includingdates, depths, volumes, etc.

On 1/3/2011 - Drilled 50' of 20" conductor hole. Set 50' of 14"conductor pipe. Cmtd w/ Ready Mix.

QEP Energy Company requests that thiswell be kept "CONFIDENTIAL".

RECEIVED
JANO4 2011

DN.0F01L,GAS&MINING

Dahn Caldwe OfficeAdmirtistrator

G U 1/4/2011

I i I

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

CONFilENR
STATE OF UTAH FORMe

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DlVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING & LEASEDESIGNATlONANDSERLALNUMBER:

UTU71416

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS ';FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

7. UNITor CA ÁGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals todrillnewwells,significantlydeepen existing wellsbelow cummt bottom-holedepth, reenterplugged weis,or t° KILIMANJARO UNITUTU88205Xdrillhorizontal laterals. UseAPPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL B. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER BW 15-18-7-22

1 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP ENERGYCOMPANY 4304751179
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, 0R WILDCAT:

11002 E.17500 S cm VERNAL STATE UT Z1P84078 (435) 781-4342 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFAce 626' FSL, 1841' FEL coUNTY: UINTAH

QTRIQTR,SECTION, TOWNSHIP,RANGE,MERlDIAN:SWSE 18 7S 22E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTlCE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATION
NOTICEOF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximatedeteworkwillstart: CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAlR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completiort

O COMMINGLEPRODUClNGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: SPUD SUNDRY
1/3/2011

CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENTFORMAT10N

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details includingdates, depths, volumes, etc.

On 1/3/2011 - Drilled 50' of 20" conductor hole. Set 50' of 14"conductor pipe. Cmtd w/ Ready Mix.

QEP Energy Company requests that thiswell be kept "CONFIDENTIAL".

RECEIVED
JANO4 2011

DN.0F01L,GAS&MINING

Dahn Caldwe OfficeAdmirtistrator

G U 1/4/2011

I i I

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



CONFIDENTIAL
STATE OF UTAH FORMS

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU71416

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME'

7. UNIT or CAAGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals todrillnew wells, signli1cantlydeepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged we!Is, or t° KILIMANJAROUNIT UTU88205Xdrillhorizontal laterals, Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform forsuch proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OlL WELL GAS WELL OTHER BW 15-18-7-22
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304751179

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH en VERNAL

STATE UT ,,84078 (435) 781-4342 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOFWELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 626' FSL, 1841' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

OTR/QTR.SECT10N, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,MERlDAN: SWSE 18 7S 22E S STATE:
UTAH

« CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Du¢îcate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date workwí11start: CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTlON TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATORCHANGE TUB1NG REPAlR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: SET CSG SPUD1/10/2011 |¯|
CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENTFORMATION SUNDRY

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

SPUD SUNDRY - SET SURFACECSG

On 1/3/2011 - Drilled 50' of 20" conductor hole. Set 50' of 14" conductor pipe. Cmtd w/ ready Mix.

On 1/10/2011 - Drill 12-1/4" hole to 535'. Run 13 jts of 9-5/8", J-55, 36#, ST&Ccsg to the depth of 522'. Pro Petro cmtd w/ 275
sxs of Class 'G' cmt

QEP Energy Company requests that this well be kept 'CONFIDENTIAL'.
RECEIVED
JAN122011

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

sNA

DT

ce Ald1ministrator

(This space for State use only)

00NADENTIAL
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

CONFIDENTIAL
STATE OF UTAH FORMS

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU71416

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME'

7. UNIT or CAAGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals todrillnew wells, signli1cantlydeepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged we!Is, or t° KILIMANJAROUNIT UTU88205Xdrillhorizontal laterals, Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform forsuch proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OlL WELL GAS WELL OTHER BW 15-18-7-22
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304751179

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH en VERNAL

STATE UT ,,84078 (435) 781-4342 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOFWELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 626' FSL, 1841' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

OTR/QTR.SECT10N, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,MERlDAN: SWSE 18 7S 22E S STATE:
UTAH

« CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Du¢îcate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

Approximate date workwí11start: CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTlON TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATORCHANGE TUB1NG REPAlR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: SET CSG SPUD1/10/2011 |¯|
CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENTFORMATION SUNDRY

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

SPUD SUNDRY - SET SURFACECSG

On 1/3/2011 - Drilled 50' of 20" conductor hole. Set 50' of 14" conductor pipe. Cmtd w/ ready Mix.

On 1/10/2011 - Drill 12-1/4" hole to 535'. Run 13 jts of 9-5/8", J-55, 36#, ST&Ccsg to the depth of 522'. Pro Petro cmtd w/ 275
sxs of Class 'G' cmt

QEP Energy Company requests that this well be kept 'CONFIDENTIAL'.

RECEIVED
JAN122011

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

sNA

DT

ce Ald1ministrator

(This space for State use only)

00NADENTIAL
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU71416

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6NIFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do notuse thisform for proposals to drill new wells,significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to KILIMANJAROUNIT UTU88205Xdrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL O GAS WELL OTHER 8 WEWLLN5AMEand N22MBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304751179

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH cm VERNAL

STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4342 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 626' FSL, 1841' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWSE 18 7S 22E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASlNG REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBlNG REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: SET CSG SPUD1/10/2011
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMAT10N SUNDRY

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

SPUD SUNDRY - SET SURFACE CSG

On 1/3/2011 - Drilled 50' of 20" conductor hole. Set 50' of 14" conductor pipe. Cmtd w/ ready Mix.

On 1/10/2011 - Drill 12-1/4" hole to 535'. Run 13 jts of 9-5/8", J-55, 36#, ST&C csg to the depth of 522'. Pro Petro cmtd w/ 275
sxs of Class 'G' cmt.

QEP Energy Company requests that this well be kept 'CONFIDENTIAL'.

NAME(PL E PRINT) Dag Cal II
TITLE Office Administrator

SIGNATURE
-

DATE 1/12/2011

(Thisspaceforstateuseon"

RECENED

CONFIDENTIALJANi 3 2011
(5/2000)

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU71416

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6NIFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do notuse thisform for proposals to drill new wells,significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to KILIMANJAROUNIT UTU88205Xdrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL

OIL WELL O GAS WELL OTHER
8 WEWLLN5AMEand N22MBER:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 4304751179

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH cm VERNAL

STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4342 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 626' FSL, 1841' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWSE 18 7S 22E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASlNG REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBlNG REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: SET CSG SPUD1/10/2011
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMAT10N SUNDRY

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

SPUD SUNDRY - SET SURFACE CSG

On 1/3/2011 - Drilled 50' of 20" conductor hole. Set 50' of 14" conductor pipe. Cmtd w/ ready Mix.

On 1/10/2011 - Drill 12-1/4" hole to 535'. Run 13 jts of 9-5/8", J-55, 36#, ST&C csg to the depth of 522'. Pro Petro cmtd w/ 275
sxs of Class 'G' cmt.

QEP Energy Company requests that this well be kept 'CONFIDENTIAL'.

NAME(PL E PRINT) Dag Cal II
TITLE Office Administrator

SIGNATURE
-

DATE 1/12/2011

(Thisspaceforstateuseon"

RECENED

CONFIDENTIALJANi 3 2011
(5/2000)

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING



CONFilENTIAL
STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT FORM 8

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES (highlightchanges)
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU71416

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: OWELLL ESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNITor CAA2GOREEXMENTNAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
HOR Z. DNEEP-

N RY
EFSFŸR.

OTHER BW 15-18-7-22
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP Energy Company 4304751179
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1050 17th St. Ste. 500 civv Denver STATE CO z 80265 (303) 672-6900 Exploratory

4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIANATSURFACE: 626 FSL, 1841 FEL

SWSE 19 7S 22E
ATTOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW: Same

12. COUNTY 13. STATEAT TOTALDEPTH: Same Uintah UTAH
14. DATESPUDDED: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATECOMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

1/2/2011 2/4/2011 3/23/2011 ABANDONED READYTOPRODUCE

18. TOTALDEPTH: MD 12,643 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS,HOW MANY7* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD
PLUG SET:

TVD 12.643 Tvo 12,500 TVD
22. TYPE ELECTRICAND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy ofeach) 23.

WAS WELLCORED7 NO YES (Submit analysis)Quad Combo
WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submit report)
DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT(#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGEDCEMENTER CNEOMENF
S

KES VOLSUœM
BBL) CEMENTTOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

12.25 9.625 J-55 36 0 522 úlaise né
8.75 7 110 26 0 6,919 CÍassG 780
6.125 4.5 110 11.6 0 12,626 Óla G 670 8850 CBL

28. TUBINGRECORD

DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD)

26. PRODUCINGINTERVALS 27. PERFORATIONRECORD
FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM(TVD) INTERVAL(ToplBot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) Mesa Verde 11,300 12,256 1 3Ö0 i È56 3.125 180 open Squeezed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENTSQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

12,168 - 12,256 29.1 bbi 15% HCI,2661 bbl slick water wl78,700 lbs 30/50 sand
12,050 - 12,064 19 bbl 15% HCI,3930 bbl slick water w/ 101,000 lbs 30/50 sand
11,445 - 11,638 23.8 bbi 15% HCI, 1973 bbi slick water w/ 49,600 lbs 30/50 sand

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT Q DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY

SUNDRYNOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENTVERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER: DrillingReport Producing
HE FIVED

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)

DIV.0FOII.,GAS&

CONFilENTIAL
STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT FORM 8

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES (highlightchanges)
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU71416

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: OWELLL ESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNITor CAA2GOREEXMENTNAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
HOR Z. DNEEP-

N RY
EFSFŸR.

OTHER BW 15-18-7-22
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP Energy Company 4304751179
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1050 17th St. Ste. 500 civv Denver STATE CO z 80265 (303) 672-6900 Exploratory

4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIANATSURFACE: 626 FSL, 1841 FEL

SWSE 19 7S 22E
ATTOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW: Same

12. COUNTY 13. STATEAT TOTALDEPTH: Same Uintah UTAH
14. DATESPUDDED: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATECOMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

1/2/2011 2/4/2011 3/23/2011 ABANDONED READYTOPRODUCE

18. TOTALDEPTH: MD 12,643 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS,HOW MANY7* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD
PLUG SET:

TVD 12.643 Tvo 12,500 TVD
22. TYPE ELECTRICAND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy ofeach) 23.

WAS WELLCORED7 NO YES (Submit analysis)Quad Combo
WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submit report)
DIRECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT(#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGEDCEMENTER CNEOMENF
S

KES VOLSUœM
BBL) CEMENTTOP ** AMOUNTPULLED

12.25 9.625 J-55 36 0 522 úlaise né
8.75 7 110 26 0 6,919 CÍassG 780
6.125 4.5 110 11.6 0 12,626 Óla G 670 8850 CBL

28. TUBINGRECORD

DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD)

26. PRODUCINGINTERVALS 27. PERFORATIONRECORD
FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM(TVD) INTERVAL(ToplBot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) Mesa Verde 11,300 12,256 1 3Ö0 i È56 3.125 180 open Squeezed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENTSQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

12,168 - 12,256 29.1 bbi 15% HCI,2661 bbl slick water wl78,700 lbs 30/50 sand
12,050 - 12,064 19 bbl 15% HCI,3930 bbl slick water w/ 101,000 lbs 30/50 sand
11,445 - 11,638 23.8 bbi 15% HCI, 1973 bbi slick water w/ 49,600 lbs 30/50 sand

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT Q DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY

SUNDRYNOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENTVERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER: DrillingReport Producing
HE FIVED

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)

DIV.0FOII.,GAS&



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #28)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
3/23/2011 3/27/2011 24 RATES: 0 1,038 380 Flowing

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
16/16 RATES: -' O 1,038 380

INTERVALB (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOlLRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INÌERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown In item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
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32. DISPOSITIONOF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

Sold
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested,cushion used,timetoolopen, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation o o m
Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu ed Depth)

Green River 3,715
Wasatch 6,808
Mesa Verde 9,748

35. ADDITIONALREMARKS (include plugg ng procedure)

28. Continued: 11,300 - 11,316: 27.10 bbl 15% HCI,2926 bbl slick water w/ 92,300 lbs 30/50 sand

36. I hereby certify that the foregolng and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Morgan Anderson TITLE RegUlatory AffairsAnalyst

SIGNATURE DATE 4/5/2011

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantlydeepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

**ITEM24:Cement Top -Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS))

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil,Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #28)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
3/23/2011 3/27/2011 24 RATES: 0 1,038 380 Flowing

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
16/16 RATES: -' O 1,038 380

INTERVALB (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOlLRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INÌERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown In item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: BG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

32. DISPOSITIONOF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

Sold
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested,cushion used,timetoolopen, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation o o m
Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu ed Depth)

Green River 3,715
Wasatch 6,808
Mesa Verde 9,748

35. ADDITIONALREMARKS (include plugg ng procedure)

28. Continued: 11,300 - 11,316: 27.10 bbl 15% HCI,2926 bbl slick water w/ 92,300 lbs 30/50 sand

36. I hereby certify that the foregolng and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Morgan Anderson TITLE RegUlatory AffairsAnalyst

SIGNATURE DATE 4/5/2011

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantlydeepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

**ITEM24:Cement Top -Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS))

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil,Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



CONFilENM..

QEP ENERGY Page 1 of 7

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/8/2011
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

1/4/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 DRL 1 MOVE IN EQUIPMENT AND RIG UP. DRILL 20" HOLE TO 50' AND SET 14"
CONDUCTOR PIPE. CEMENT WITH READY MIXTRUCK.

15:00 - 17:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRILL MOUSE HOLE AND PUT LINER IN. RIG DOWN AND MOVE OUT
17:00 - NOTIFIED DONNA KENNY WITH THE BLMAND CAROL WITH UTAH OIL AND

GAS IN REGUARDS TO SETTING CONDUTOR PIPE ON SUNDAY 1/02/2011 @
10"00 AM.

1/10/2011 15:00 - 19:00 4.00 LOC 4 MOVE IN PRO PETRO AND RIG UP TO DRILL SURFACE HOLE
19:00 - 23:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/50' T/535'
23:00 - 00:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN AND LAY DOW DRILL PIPE
00:00 - 02:30 2.50 CSG 2 RUN 13 JTS OF 9 5/8", 36.0#,J-55, ST&C CASING TO 522'
02:30 -03:00 0.50 LOC 4 RIG DOWN AND MOVE RIG OUT
03:00 -04:00 1.00 CMT 2 RIG UP PRO PETRO CEMENTERS AND PUMP CEMENT. 30 BBLS FRESH

WATER, 20 BBL GEL FLUSH, 275 SACKS OF CLASS G CEMENT, DISPLACED
WITH 37.6 BBLS OF WATER. PLUG BUMPED AND FLOATS HELD, 17 BBLS OF
CEMENT TO SURFACE. NO TOP JOB NEEDED, CEMENT STAYED TO
SURFACE

04:00 - 05:00 1.00 LOC 4 RIG DWON MOVE OUT
05:00 - NOTIFIED DONNA KENNY WITH THE BLMAND CAROL WITH UTAH OlL AND

GAS IN REGAURDS TO DRILLINGAND SETTING SURFACE CASING ON
FRIDAY 1/08/2011 @ 10:00 AM.

1/12/2011 06:00 -06:00 24.00 LOC 4 RIG DOWN PREPARE OF TRUCKS, DRAIN UP RIG
1/13/2011 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 LOC 4 MOVE RIG AND RIGUP, TRUCKS LEFT LOCATION

AT 18:00 HRS ON 01/12/2011
1/14/2011 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 LOC 4 RIG UP TOP DRIVE AND HYDRAULIC LINES

08:00 - 18:00 10.00 BOP 1 NIPPLE UP BOP AND MANIFOLD
18:00 -02:00 8.00 BOP 2 TEST BOPE AND CASING. TESTED

UPPER KELLYVALVE, SAFETY VALVE, DART VALVE,
PIPE RAMS ,BLIND RAMS, HCR VALVE, SUPPER CHOKE,
MANIFOLDAND VALVES TO 250 PSI LOW, 5000 PSI HIGH
TESTED ANNULAR 250 PSI LOW, 2500 PSI HIGH.
TESTED CASING TO 1500 PSI AND HELD FOR 30 MIN.

02:00 -04:00 2.00 BOP 1 RIG UP CHOKE LINES AND GAS BUSTER.
04:00 - 05:00 1.00 TRP 1 GET BHA ON RACKS AND STRAP
05:00 - 06:00 1.00 RIG 6 CUT DRILLINGLINE

1/15/2011 06:00 -08:00 2.00 RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE
08:00 - 09:00 1.00 OTH INSTALLWEAR BUSHING
09:00 - 11:30 2.50 TRP 1 PICK UP BHA, TAGGED UP AT 475 FT.
11:30 - 12:30 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT AND IN FOR BAFFEL PLATE
12:30 - 14:30 2.00 OTH PRIME PUMPS AND ADJUST TORQUE ON TOP DRIVE
14:30 - 15:30 1.00 DRL 4 DRILL OUT SHOE TRACK
15:30 - 17:30 2.00 RIG 2 WORK ON GRABBERS FOR TOP DRIVE, CHANGE OUT SLIP

DIES, AND WORK ON FLOW LINE
17:30 - 18:30 1.00 DRL 4 DRILL SHOE TRACK ----HELD BOP DRILL
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 EQT 2 FIT, WOULD NOT HOLD ANY PRESSURE
19:00 - 22:30 3.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM536 TO 826, = 290 FT. = 82 FT./ PH.

40 RPM AT TOP DRIVE, 10 K WT, 325 GPM, MUD MOTOR .17 RPG
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 750 FT. = DEV 0.7 AZI. 58.2
23:00 -03:30 4.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 826 TO 1336 = 510 FT. = 113.3 FT./ PH

10 K ON BIT, 40 RPM ON TOP DRIVE, 105 SPM ON BOTH PUMPS,
MUD MOTOR .17 RPG, MUD WT. 8.4

03:30 - 04:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY AT 1257. .9 DEG. 185.0 AZl -- HELD BOP DRILL
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 1336 TO 1550 FT. = 214 FT.= 107 FT. I PH

1/16/2011 06:00 -08:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM1550 TO 1780. = 230 FT. = 115 FT./ HR RECEIVED
APR07
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/8/2011
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

1/16/2011 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 DRL 1 10 K ON BIT, 50 RPM ON TOP DRIVE, 500 GPM, .17 MUD MOTOR
08:00 -08:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY@ 1720 =

.6 DEG. 182 AZI
08:30 - 09:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG
09:00 - 13:30 4.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 1780 TO 2288. = 508 FT. = 112.9 FT./ HR
13:30 - 16:00 2.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT TO RETRIEIVE SURVEY TOOL

16:00 - 16:30 0.50 SUR 1 GET SURVEY TOOL OUT
SURVEY @2230 = 1.3 DEG. 157.8 AZI

16:30 - 19:00 2.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE. BRIDGE AT 1730 FT.
19:00 - 19:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH AND REAM LAST 60 FT. = 30 FT. OF FILL

19:30 - 00:00 4.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 2288 TO 2798. = 510 FT. = 113.3 FT./ HR
00:00 -00:30 0.50 SUR 1 WlRE LINE SURVEY @2728 =

.8 DEG. 110.7 AZI.
00:30 - 04:30 4.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 2798 TO 3180. = 382 FT. = 95.5 FT./ HR
04:30 -05:00 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 3110. =

.8 DEG, 130.4 DIRECTION
05:00 - 06:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 3180 TO 3250. = 70 FT. = 70 FT./ HR

1/17/2011 06:00 - 12:30 6.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 3250 TO 3624. = 374 FT. = 57.5 FT./ HR.
10 K ON BIT, 500 GPM, 50 RPM ON TOP DRIVE, .17 RPG MUD MOTOR.
LOST 20 BBLS AT 3480 FT.

12:30 - 13:00 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY @3565 = 1.0 DEG. 122.7 AZI.
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:30 - 14:30 1.00 RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, REPLACE WATER BOX ON DWKS.

14:30 - 23:00 8.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 3624 TO 4132 FT. = 508 FT. = 59.7 FT. I HR
23:00 - 23:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY @4062 = 1.1 DEG. 128.7 AZI.
23:30 -06:00 6.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 4132 TO 4525 = 393 FT. = 60.5 FT./ HR.

12 K ON BIT, 500 GPM , 50 RPM ON TOP DRIVE, .17 GPR MUD MOTOR.
1/18/2011 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 4525 TO 4641. = 116 FT. = 58 FT./ HR

12 K ON BIT, 50 RPM ON TOP DRIVE, 500 GPM
PUMP RATE, .17 RPG MUD MOTOR

08:00 -08:30 0.50 SUR 1 RUN WIRE LINE SURVEY @4580 = 1.4 DEG. 114.4 AZI.
08:30 - 22:30 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 4641 TO 5149. = 508 FT. = 36.3 FT. / HR
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 SUR 1 WlRE LINE SURVEY AT 5079. = 1.3 DEG. 126.3 AZI.

LOST 20 BBLS ON SURVEY
23:00 - 06:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 5149 TO 5400. = 251 FT. = 35.8 FT./ HR

8 TO 14 K ON BIT, 50 RPM ON TOP DRIVE, 500 GPM
PUMP RATE W / 2 PUMPS, .17 RPG MUD MOTOR.

1/19/2011 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 5400 TO 5495. = 95 FT. = 27.1 FT. I HR.
16 K ON BIT, 500 GPM W / BOTH PUMPS, 50 RPM ON
TOP DRIVE, .17 RPG MUD MOTOR

09:30 - 11:00 1.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT FOR BIT
11:00 - 12:30 1.50 TRP 10 WORK TIGHT HOLE FROM 4078 TO 4046,

CCIRC AND WORK STRING. LOST 200 BBLS

12:30 - 16:00 3.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT FOR BIT
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 TRP 1 CHANGE BIT AND WORK BLIND RAMS AND ANNULAR
16:30 - 21:00 4.50 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE AND FILL PIPE AT 3800 FT.[ FULL CIRCULATION ]
21:00 - 21:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH AND REAM 100 FT. TO BOTTOM.

LOST200 BBLSWASHINGTO BOTTOM.

Printed: 4/5/2011 10:08:03
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/8/2011
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

1/19/2011 21:30 - 01:00 3.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 5495 TO 5667. = 172 FT. = 49.1 FT. / HR.
16 K ON BIT, 500 GPM W / BOTH PUMPS, 50 RPM ON
TOP DRIVE, .17 RPG MUD MOTOR

01:00 -01:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY @5587 = 2.2 DEG. 123.3 AZI.
01:30 - 06:00 4.50 DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 5667 TO 5850 = 183 FT. = 40.6 FT. I HR.

1/20/2011 06:00 -09:30 3.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 5850 TO 5943. = 93 FT. = 26.6 FT. I HR
16 K ON BIT, 50 RPM ON TOP DRIVE, 500 GPM WITH
BOTH PUMPS, .17 RPG MUD MOTOR.

09:30 - 10:00 0.50 CIRC 2 LOST CIRCULATION, LOST 120 BBLS,CIRCULATE
AND BUILDVOLUME

10:00 - 18:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 5943 TO 6165. = 222 FT. = 26.1 FT. I HR
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY @6092 = 1.8 DEG. = 129.1 AZI.

AFTER SURVEY, WORK PIPE AND REGAIN CIRCULATION.
LOST 150 BBLS.

19:30 - 22:00 2.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 6165 TO 6228 FT. = 63 FT. = 25.2 FT. I HR.

22:00 - 22:30 0.50 CIRC 2 LOST CIRCULATION, WORK PIPE AND MIX LCM.
LOST 150 BBLS OF FLUID @6228 CONNECTION.

22:30 - 06:00 7.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM6228 TO 6385. = 157 FT. = 20.9 FT./ HR
1/21/2011 06:00 - 12:30 6.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 6385 TO 6577. = 192 FT. = 29.5 FT./ HR

18 K ON BIT, 500 GPM, 50 RPM ON TOP DRIVE,
.17 RPG MUD MOTOR.

12:30 - 13:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:00 -00:00 11.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 6577 TO 6930. = 353 FT. = 32.1 FT./ HR.
00:00 -01:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND PUMP SWEEPS
01:00 - 01:30 0.50 TRP 14 TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND STRAP PIPE

01:30 - 02:30 1.00 REAM 1 BACK REAM FROM 6855 TO 6668.
LOST 200 BBLS WHILE BACK REAMING.

02:30 - 06:00 3.50 TRP 14 TRIP OUT OF HOLE. STRAP PIPE
1/22/2011 06:00 -07:00 1.00 TRP 14 SHORT TRIP OUT TO CASING, SLM

07:00 - 11:30 4.50 TRP 14 TRIP IN HOLE, BRIDGE AT 2160 AND 6831
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH AND REAM FROM 6831 TO 6930,

7 FT. OF FILL
12:00 - 14:00 2.00 ClRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE.
14:00 - 15:00 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP GYRO AND DRY JOB
15:00 - 21:00 6.00 TRP 3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE AND GYRO OUT.
21:00 - 22:00 1.00 SUR 1 RETRIEVE GYRO ON WIRE LINE AND SURVEY

EVERY 100 FT. FROM 1100 FT.
22:00 - 23:30 1.50 TRP 3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE AND BHA
23:30 -00:00 0.50 OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
00:00 - 02:00 2.00 CSG 1 RIG UP CASERS AND CHANGE BAILS

HAD TO MOVE TRACK.
02:00 - 05:00 3.00 CSG 2 PJSM AND RUN CASING
05:00 - 06:00 1.00 OTH WORK ON AND CHANGE OUT CASING TONGS

1/23/2011 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CSG 2 RUN 7" CASING
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 OTH CIRCULATE AND ADJUST TOP DRIVE TRACK
07:30 - 13:00 5.50 CSG 2 RUN 7" CASING
13:00 - 14:30 1.50 REAM 1 WASH 130 FT. TO BOTTOM
14:30 - 15:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE FOR CASING
15:30 -21:00 5.50 CMT 2 PJSM, RIG UP CEMENTERS,TEST LINES,

PUMP CEMENT, 40 BBLS SUPER FLUSH,
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AFTER SURVEY, WORK PIPE AND REGAIN CIRCULATION.
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/8/2011
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

1/23/2011 15:30 - 21:00 5.50 CMT 2 LEAD CEMENT WAS 570 SKS OF EXTENDACEM,
TAIL WAS 210 SKS. OF ECONOCEM, DISPLACED
WITH 262 BBLS OF FRESH WATER. PLUG BUMPED
AND FLOATS HELD. 160 BBLS OF CEMENT TO SURFACE.

21:00 - 22:00 1.00 CMT 1 RIG DOWN CEMENTERS AND FLUSH OUT BOPE.
22:00 -00:30 2.50 DEQ 4 PULL LANDING JT. AND SET AND TEST PACK OFF

TO 5000 PSI
00:30 - 02:30 2.00 BOP 1 CHANGE OUT PIPE RAMS, CHANGE EL.EVATORS,

BAILS. SAVER SUB.
02:30 -06:00 3.50 BOP 2 TEST BOP AND SURFACE LINES BACK TO PUMP.

1/24/2011 06:00 -07:00 1.00 BOP 2 TEST CASING TO 1500 PSI 30 MIN. TESTED BOPE,
TESTED KELLYVALVE, SAFETY VALVE, INSIDE
BOP, PIPE RAMS, CHOKE LINE, HCR VALVE, KILL
LINE, MANIFOLD, BLINE RAMS, SUPER CHOKE TO
250 PSI LOW PRESSURE AND 5000 PSI HIGH PRESSURE.
TESTED ANNULAR TO 250 PSI LOW, 2500 PSI HIGH,
TESTED KELLY HOSE BACK TO PUMP 3500 PSI.
TESTED CASING TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MIN

07:00 -08:30 1.50 OTH ADJUST TOP DRIVE TRACK AND SET TORQUE SETTING
FOR 3 1/2 IF DRILL PIPE.

08:30 - 09:00 0.50 TRP 2 INSTALLWEAR BUSHING
09:00 - 10:00 1.00 RIG 6 CUT AND SLIP 120 FT. OF DRILLING LINE
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 TRP 1 PJSM AND RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 DRL 3 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND ORIENT.
11:30 - 19:30 8.00 TRP 1 PICK UP 3 1/2 DP AND HWDP AND STRAP
19:30 - 20:00 0.50 TRP 1 RIGDOWN LAY DOWN MACHINE
20:00 - 21:30 1.50 DRL 2 DRILL OUT CEMENT AND SHOE TRACK

PLUS 5 FT. OF NEW HOLE
21:30 - 22:00 0.50 EQT 2 FIT, EMW = 9.4 AT 6935.
22:00 - 06:00 8.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 6935 TO 7270 = 335 FT. = 41.8 FPH

DIRILLINGWI 12 K ON BIT, 240 GPM ON PUMPS
60 PRM ON TOP DRIVE, .26 RPG ON 1.5 DEG. BENT MOTOR.
SLIDE DRILLINGW/240 GPM PUMP, 8 K WT. ON BIT.

06:00 - WE DID 3 -- 10 FT SLIDES IN 2 HRS. = 15 FPH AVE.
1/25/2011 06:00 - 15:30 9.50 DRL 2 DRILL FROM 7270 TO 7649 FT. = 379 FT. = 39.8 FPH

14 K ON BIT,240 GPM ON PUMP, 60 RPM ON TOP
DRIVE, .26 RPG MUD MOTOR, 1.5 BEND.
SLIDING WITH 8-10 K ON BIT, 240 GPM PUMP

15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 2 RIG SERVICE

16:00 - 06:00 14.00 DRL 2 DRILL FROM 7649 TO 8350. = 701 FT. = 50.1 FPH
06:00 - 8 SLIDES = 98 FT = 7 HRS. = 14 FPH

DRILLING = 982 FT. 16.5 HRS. = 59.5 FPH
1/26/2011 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DRL 2 DRILL FROM 8350 TO TO 8793. = 443 FT. = 44.3 FPH

DRILLING WITH 14 K ON BIT, 240 GPM ON PUMPS,
60 RPM ON TOP DRIVE. .26 GPM MUD MOTOR, 1.5 BEND.
SLIDE WITH 10- 12 K ON BIT, 240 GPM ON PUMPS

16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
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Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/8/2011
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

1/26/2011 16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RIG 1
16:30 - 00:30 8.00 DRL 2 DRILL FROM 8793 TO 9173 =380 FT. = 47.5 FPH.
00:30 -01:00 0.50 SUR 1 WORK WITH MWD, NO SIGNAL
01:00 - 01:30 0.50 CIRC 1 MIXAND PUMP DRY PILL

01:30 - 03:30 2.00 TRP 13 TRIP FOR MWD TOOL, TIGHT HOLE @8808
BACK REAMED FROM 8795 TO 8808

03:30 - 04:00 0.50 CIRC 1 MIXAND PUMP DRY PILL
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 TRP 13 TRIP OUT FOR MWD TOOL
06:00 - 3 SLIDES = 45 FT. IN 3.5 HRS. = 12.8 FPH.

DRILLINGAT 53.6 FPH

1/27/2011 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 TRP 13 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR MWD
07:00 -08:30 1.50 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT MOTOR, BIT AND MWD. ORIENT AND TEST TOOLS
08:30 - 14:30 6.00 TRP 13 TRIP IN HOLE
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH 65' TO BOTTOM, NO FILL
15:00 -05:00 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLING F/9173 T/10099 926' 66.1'lHR

WOB 14/15 RPM 126 GPM 254
05:00 -06:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS

28' OF SLIDE IN 1.2 HRS,
1/28/2011 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 DRL 2 DRILLING F/10099 T/10286 187' 46.7'lHR

WOB 14/15 RPM 126 GPM 254
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
10:30 - 17:00 6.50 DRL 2 DRILLINGF/10286 T/10605 319' 58'lHR

WOB 14/15 RPM 126 GPM 254
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS
18:00 - 21:00 3.00 DRL 2 DRILLING F/10605 Tl10701 96' 32'lHR
21:00 - 22:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULTE BOTTOMS AND PUMP TRIP SLUG
23:00 - 06:00 7.00 TRP 13 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR MWD FAILURE

1/29/2011 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND BIT, CHECK MUD MOTOR AND
TEST

08:00 - 12:30 4.50 TRP 13 TRIP IN HOLE TO CASING SHOE
12:30 - 15:00 2.50 RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE, SLIP ON NEW SPOOL OF DRILLING LINE
15:00 - 18:30 3.50 TRP 13 TRIP IN HOLE
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 REAM 1 REAM FROM 10450' TO 10701', RATTY IN SPOTS
19:30 -05:00 9.50 DRL 2 DRILLING F/10701' T/10940 239 25.1'llHR

WOB 14/15 RPM 110 GPM 242
05:00 - 06:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS

1/30/2011 06:00 - 12:30 6.50 DRL 2 DRILLING F/10940 T/11243 303' 46.6'llHR
WOB 15 RPM 115 GPM 254

12:30 - 13:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:00 - 17:00 4.00 DRL 2 DRILLING F/11243 T/11442 199' 49.7S'lHR
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS
18:00 -05:00 11.00 DRL 2 DRILLING F/11442 T/11848 406' 36.9'/HR

WOB 15 RPM 110 GPM 242
05:00 -06:00 1.00 SUR 1 CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS

1/31/2011 06:00 - 17:00 11.00 DRL 2 DRILLING F/11848 T/12168 220 20'lHR
WOB 15 RPM 110 GPM 242

17:00 - 18:00 1.00 SUR 1 CONNECTION AND SURVEYS
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 DRL 2 DRILLING F/12168 T/12179 11' 11'lHR
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR TRIP AND PUMP TRIP SLUG
20:30 -02:00 5.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT, SLM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/8/2011
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

1/31/2011 02:00 - 02:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
02:30 -06:00 3.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUTOF HOLE FOR BIT, SLM

2/1/2011 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT MOTOR AND BIT, ORIENT AND TEST TOOLS
I SLM =12171, TALLEY= 12179, 8' DIFFERENCE NO CORRECTION

07:30 - 15:00 7.50 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT #6 TIGHT @10,505'
15:00 - 16:30 1.50 REAM 1 REAM F/11,670' T/11,810 AND WASH 45' TO BOTTOM
16:30 - 05:00 12.50 DRL 2 DRILLING F/12,179 T/12,368 189' 15.1'lHR

WOB 15/16 RPM 110 GPM 242
05:00 - 06:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEYS AND CONNECTIONS

2/2/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 DRL 2 DRILLING F/12,368 T/12446 78' 8.T/HR
WOB 15/20 RPM 80/125 GPM 242

15:00 - 16:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATEAND CONDTION HOLE FOR TRIP
16:30 - 21:30 5.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT
21:30 - 22:30 1.00 RIG 2 CHANGE OUT DRUM WATERBOX
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
23:00 - 02:00 3.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT
02:00 -02:30 0.50 TRP 10 CHECK MOTOR, CHANGE BITS
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE WIT BIT #7

2/3/2011 06:00 -08:00 2.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE Wl BIT #7 TO SHOE
08:00 - 09:00 1.00 RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE
09:00 - 12:00 3.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE WI BIT #7
12:00 - 16:30 4.50 REAM i WASH AND REAM F/9910 T/10858
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE, PUMP HIGH VIS SWEEP
18:00 - 22:00 4.00 REAM 1 WASH AND REAM F/10858 T/12446, 10' FILL
22:00 -05:30 7.50 DRL 1 DRILLING F/12446 T/12625 179 23.9'lHR

WOB 12, RPM 60/105, 230 GPM
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 SURVEYS AND CONNERCTIONS

2/4/2011 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 DRL 2 DRILLING F/12625 T/12643 18' 18'lHR
WOB 13/14 RPM 105 GPM 230

07:00 - 09:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR SHORT TRIP, PUMP HIGH VIS
SWEEPS
PUMP TRIP SLUG

09:00 - 13:00 4.00 TRP 15 SHORT TRIP TO 9600', TIGHT SPOT @ 9765'
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH 65' TO BOTTOM, NO FILL
13:30 - 15:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR LOGS, PUMP HIGH VIS SWEEPS
15:00 - 22:00 7.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR LOGS, LAID DOWN JARS, 1 HWDP
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 TRP 1 LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
23:00 -01:00 2.00 LOG 3 PICK UP SHUTTLE LOG TOOLS
01:00 -06:00 5.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE WITH LOGS

2/5/2011 06:00 -08:30 2.50 LOG 1 TRIP IN HOLE WITH SHUTTLE LOGS
08:30 - 09:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH 45' TO BOTTOM, NO FILL
09:00 - 11:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULTE BOTTOMS UP, DROP DART AND DEPLOY SHUTTLE LOGS
11:30 - 21:30 10.00 LOG 1 TRIP OUT OF HOLE LOGGING WITH SHUTTLE LOG F/12628 TISURFACE
21:30 - 22:30 1.00 LOG 3 LAY DOWN SHUTTLE LOGGING TOOLS
22:30 - 23:30 1.00 OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
23:30 - 00:00 0.50 LOG 3 CONFIRM LOGS
00:00 - 02:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN TO 4900' TO LAY DOWN PIPE
02:00 - 03:00 1.00 TRP 3 HOLD SAFETY MEETING AND RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK
03:00 -06:00 3.00 TRP 3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE AND BHA

2/6/2011 06:00 -07:30 1.50 CSG 1 HOLD SAFETY MEETING,MOVE TOP DRIVE TRACK IN,CHANGE OUT BAILS
AND RIG UP CASING CREW

07:30 - 14:00 6.50 CSG 2 RUN 4 1/2" CASINGto 7609' TIGHT INSIDE CASING @6320 AND @7609 IN
THE OPEN HOLE

Printed: 4/5/2011 10:08:03
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Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/8/2011
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations
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21:30 - 22:30 1.00 RIG 2 CHANGE OUT DRUM WATERBOX
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23:00 - 02:00 3.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT
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22:30 - 23:30 1.00 OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
23:30 - 00:00 0.50 LOG 3 CONFIRM LOGS
00:00 - 02:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN TO 4900' TO LAY DOWN PIPE
02:00 - 03:00 1.00 TRP 3 HOLD SAFETY MEETING AND RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK
03:00 -06:00 3.00 TRP 3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE AND BHA
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/8/2011
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

Date From - To Hours Code DescriptiÃrof Operations

2/6/2011 14:00 - 16:30 2.50 CSG 2 WORK TIGHT HOLE F/7609 T/7670
16:30 - 23:00 6.50 CSG 2 LAY DOWN 4 1/2" CASING

TWO MARKER JOINTS WERE FLATTENED.
23:00 -01:00 2.00 OTH MOVE TOP DRIVE TRACK OUT, CHANGE OUT BAILS, RIG UP TO PICK UP

PIPE
01:00 - 01:30 0.50 OTH STRAP BHA
01:30 - 06:00 4.50 TRP 2 PICK UP PIPE

2/7/2011 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 TRP 2 PICK UP DRILL PIPE
06:30 - 07:30 1.00 OTH RIG DOWN LAYDOWN TRUCK
07:30 - 08:30 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE TO CASING SHOE
08:30 - 09:30 1.00 RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE
09:30 - 13:30 4.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE TIGHT SPOT @ 9565 AND 12328
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 REAM 1 REAM F/12320 T/12332 AND 125' TO BOTTOM, 8' OF FILL
14:00 - 21:00 7.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE, RU LD MACHINE, PUMP SLUG

UNLAOD NEW CASING AND LOAD OUT OLD CASING
21:00 - 22:00 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT 20 STANDS
22:00 -05:30 7.50 TRP 3 LAY DOWN PIPE AND BHA
05:30 -06:00 0.50 OTH CHANGE OUT BAILS AND MOVE TOP DRIVE TRACK

2/8/2011 06:00 -07:00 1.00 CSG 1 HOLD SAFETY MEETING AND RIG UP TO RUN CASING
07:00 - 16:00 9.00 CSG 2 RUN 287 JOINTS 4 1/2", P-110,11.6# LT&C CASING LANDED @12,625'
16:00 - 18:00 2.00 CIRC 1 LAND HANGER AND CIRCULTE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR CEMENT

RIG DOWN CASERS
18:00 - 18:30 0.50 CSG 1 HOLD SAFETY MEETING AND RIG UP HALLIBURTON
18:30 -22:00 3.50 CMT 2 PUMP CEMENT-20 BBL CACL FLUSH,30 BBL SUPER FLUSH,LEAD 390 SACKS

EXTENACEM, TAIL 280 SACKS OF EXPANDACEM. NO RETURNS AFTER THE
PLUG WAS DROPPED. DISPLACED WITH 113 BBLS OF KCL BEFORE
PRESSURE WAS TOO HIGH TO PUMP. CEMENT @7284 INSIDE CASING.
RELEASED PRESSURE AND NO FLOW BACK.

22:00 - 22:30 0.50 CMT 1 RIGDOWN CEMENTERS
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 DEQ 2 SET PACK OFF SUPPORT
23:00 - 06:00 7.00 BOP 1 NIPPLE DOWN BOP, CLEAN PITS

RIG RELEASED @06:00HRS 2/8/20111

RECEIVED
APR07 200

DIVOFOlL,GAS&MINWS
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

3/3/2011 12:00 - 13:00 1.00 LOC 3 3/3/11: ROAD RIG 14-MILES TO LOCATION.
13:00 - 15:00 2.00 OTH ATTEMPT TO SPOT RIG AND EQUIPMENT. TO MUDDYTO GET UP TO

WELLHEAD.PARK EQUIPMENT OUT OF WAY. SDFD.
15:00 - 16:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN.

3/4/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/4/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
07:00 -07:30 0.50 LOC 4 ATTEMPTED TO SPOT RIG IN, COULDN'T GET BACKED INTO WELLHEAD

DUE TO SOFT GROUND.
07:30 - 10:45 3.25 LOC 5 HAULED IN MORE ROCKS AND ROAD BASE FOR RIG PAD.
10:45 - 12:00 1.25 LOC 4 SPOT EQUIPMENT. MIRU.
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 BOP 1 ND WELHEAD ASSEMBLY. NU BOP'S. RU TBG EQUIPMENT.
13:30 - 15:00 1.50 OTH SPOT PUMP, TANK AND CIRCULATING TANK. LAY PUMP LINES. SWI FOR

WEEKEND.
3/7/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/7/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION.

07:00 - 07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING. CHECK PRESSURE: SICP= 0-PSI.
07:15 - 08:15 1.00 TRP 1 PU AND MU 3 3/4" PDC BIT, 3 1/8" MUD MOTOR WITH STRING FLOAT ON TOP

AS BHA. PUMPED FRESH WATER THROUGH MOTOR. WORKING GOOD.
08:15 - 13:30 5.25 TRP 5 TALLY, RABBIT AND RIH WITH BHA AND 200-JT'S 2 3/8" L-80 4.7# TBG. EOT@

6520'. CHANGED OUT TBG FLOATS. CONTINUED TO TALLY, RABBIT AND RIH
WITH AN ADDITIONAL 15-JT'S TBG. EOT@ 7020'.

13:30 - 14:30 1.00 CIRC 1 RU PUMP AND TANK. LOAD TBG WITH 30-BBLS FRESH WATER. PUMPED AN
ADDITIONAL 70-BBLS TO CLEAN HOLE UP. RD PUMP.

14:30 - 14:45 0.25 TRP 5 POOH WITH 2-JT'S TBG TO DROP FLUID LEVEL. EOT@ 6955'. ESTIMATE 330'
ABOVE CEMENT TOP. SWI.

14:45 - 15:15 0.50 SEQ 1 PU AND HANG POWER SWIVEL IN DERRICK. RU CIRCULATING EQUIPMENT.
15:15 - 15:30 0.25 RIG 3 DRAIN PUMP AND LINES. SDFD.
15:30 - 17:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN.

3/8/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/8/11:TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
07:00 -07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING: CHECK PRESSURE: SICP= O PSI. SITP= 0 PSI.
07:15 - 08:00 0.75 TRP 5 RIG UP PUMP LINES, PICK UP 4-JTS TBG. TAG SOFT CMT@ 7075'.
08:00 -08:15 0.25 SEQ 1 PICK UP POWER SWIVEL.
08:15 - 17:30 9.25 DRL 4 GET CIRCULATION WITH HOLE STANDING FULL. CLEAN OUT SOFT CMT

DOWN TO 7083' AND START DRILLING HARD CEMENT@ 8:20, PUMPING @
2-BPM WITH 600# PSI. PUMP PRESSURE. DRILL HARD CEMENT DOWN TO
7530'

17:30 - 18:15 0.75 CIRC 1 PUMP 125BBLS SWEEP TO CLEAN HOLE FOR THE NIGHT
18:15 - 18:30 0.25 SEQ 1 HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL: CHANGE ELEVATOR TO 2 3/8:
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 TRP 5 LAY DOWN 2JTS: SHUT WELL IN : DRAIN PUMP AND LINES
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL HOME

3/9/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/9/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 - 07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING : CHECK PRESSURE:
07:15 - 07:45 0.50 TRP 5 RIG UP PUMP LINES: PICK UP 2JTS, TAG HARD CEMENT @7530'
07:45 - 08:00 0.25 SEQ 1 PICK UP POWER SWIVEL
08:00 - 17:30 9.50 DRL 4 GET CIRCULATION WITH HOLE STANDING FULL: START DRILLING HARD

CEMENT @8:10 AM @7530': PRESSURE @ PUMP 800PSI: AT 7687 HIT
SOFTER CEMENT : 1:30 PM PUMP 125BBL SWEEP @8036'WHILE DRILLING
DRILL DOWN TO 8381'

17:30 - 18:15 0.75 CIRC 1 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP : CIRCULATE CLEAN
18:15 - 18:30 0.25 SEQ 1 HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 TRP 5 CHANGE ELEVAOTRS: LAYDOWN 2 JTS: DRAIN LINES AND PUMPS: SHUT

WELL IN FOR NIGHT
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL HOME

3/10/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/10/11 TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 -07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING: CHECK PRESSURE ,

SICP= OPSI SITP= OPSI

Printed: 4/5/2011 10:08:37
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3/4/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/4/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
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08:15 - 13:30 5.25 TRP 5 TALLY, RABBIT AND RIH WITH BHA AND 200-JT'S 2 3/8" L-80 4.7# TBG. EOT@

6520'. CHANGED OUT TBG FLOATS. CONTINUED TO TALLY, RABBIT AND RIH
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13:30 - 14:30 1.00 CIRC 1 RU PUMP AND TANK. LOAD TBG WITH 30-BBLS FRESH WATER. PUMPED AN
ADDITIONAL 70-BBLS TO CLEAN HOLE UP. RD PUMP.

14:30 - 14:45 0.25 TRP 5 POOH WITH 2-JT'S TBG TO DROP FLUID LEVEL. EOT@ 6955'. ESTIMATE 330'
ABOVE CEMENT TOP. SWI.
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15:15 - 15:30 0.25 RIG 3 DRAIN PUMP AND LINES. SDFD.
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3/8/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/8/11:TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
07:00 -07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING: CHECK PRESSURE: SICP= O PSI. SITP= 0 PSI.
07:15 - 08:00 0.75 TRP 5 RIG UP PUMP LINES, PICK UP 4-JTS TBG. TAG SOFT CMT@ 7075'.
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18:15 - 18:30 0.25 SEQ 1 HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL: CHANGE ELEVATOR TO 2 3/8:
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 TRP 5 LAY DOWN 2JTS: SHUT WELL IN : DRAIN PUMP AND LINES
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL HOME

3/9/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/9/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 - 07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING : CHECK PRESSURE:
07:15 - 07:45 0.50 TRP 5 RIG UP PUMP LINES: PICK UP 2JTS, TAG HARD CEMENT @7530'
07:45 - 08:00 0.25 SEQ 1 PICK UP POWER SWIVEL
08:00 - 17:30 9.50 DRL 4 GET CIRCULATION WITH HOLE STANDING FULL: START DRILLING HARD

CEMENT @8:10 AM @7530': PRESSURE @ PUMP 800PSI: AT 7687 HIT
SOFTER CEMENT : 1:30 PM PUMP 125BBL SWEEP @8036'WHILE DRILLING
DRILL DOWN TO 8381'

17:30 - 18:15 0.75 CIRC 1 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP : CIRCULATE CLEAN
18:15 - 18:30 0.25 SEQ 1 HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 TRP 5 CHANGE ELEVAOTRS: LAYDOWN 2 JTS: DRAIN LINES AND PUMPS: SHUT

WELL IN FOR NIGHT
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL HOME

3/10/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/10/11 TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 -07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING: CHECK PRESSURE ,

SICP= OPSI SITP= OPSI
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

3/10/2011 07:15 - 07:45 0.50 TRP 5 RIG UP PUMP LINES: PICK UP 2JTS: TAG CEMENT @8381'
07:45 - 08:00 i 0.25 SEQ \ 1 RIG UP POWER SWIVEL: CHANGE OUT CROSS OVER.
08:00 - 11:15 3.25 DRL 4 GET CIRCULATION WITH HOLE STANDING FULL:CHANGE OUT

WASHINGTON HEAD RUBBER : START TO DRILL CEMENT @ 8381' PUMP
PRESSURE=900PSI :DRILLTO 8694':

11:15 - 11:30 0.25 OTH TIE BACK TO SINGLE FAST
11:30 - 17:30 6.00 DRL 4 RESUME DRILLING@ 8694:@ 1:30pm PUMP 125BBL SWEEP WHILE

DRILLING:
DRILLTO 9478'

17:30 - 18:30 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP TO CLEAN HOLE OUT FOR THE NIGHT
18:30 - 18:45 0.25 SEQ 1 HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
18:45 - 19:00 0.25 TRP 5 LAYDOWN 2JTS: DRAIN PUMP AND LINES: SWIFN
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN

3/11/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/11/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 -07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING:CHECK PRESSURES SICP= OPSI SITP=0PSI
07:15 - 07:30 0.25 TRP 5 RIG UP PUMP LINES: PICK UP 2JTS TAG CEMENT @9478'
07:30 -07:45 0.25 SEQ 1 PICK UP POWER SWIVEL
07:45 - 17:30 9.75 DRL 4 GET CIRCULATION WITH HOLE STANDING FULL: RESUME DRILLING@9478'

@10:30PUMP 125BBL SWEEP WHILE DRILLING DEPTH @9978'
@2:00PUMP 125BBL SWEEP WHILE DRILLING , DEPTH @10478'
DRILLTO 10976'

17:30 - 18:30 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP TO CLEAN HOLE FOR NIGHT
18:30 - 18:45 0.25 SEQ 1 HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
18:45 - 19:00 0.25 TRP 5 LAY DOWN 2 JTS: DRAIN PUMP AND LINE SWIFN.
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN

3/12/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/12/11 TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 -07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING; CHECK PRESSURE SICP= OPSI SITP=0PSI
07:15 -07:30 0.25 TRP 5 PICK 2JTS : RIG UP PUMP LINES: CHANGE ELEVATORS
07:30 -07:45 0.25 SEQ 1 RIG UP POWER SWIVEL
07:45 - 16:30 8.75 DRL 4 GET CIRCULATION WITH HOLE STANDING FULL: PUMP PRESSURE 1000PSI

RESUME DRILLING@ 10976 : 10:30 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP WHILE DRILLING
DEPTH 11476'; 1:30 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP WHILE DRILLING DEPTH 11991'
HIT TOTAL DEPTH 11250'

16:30 - 17:30 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP TO CLEAN WELL OUT
17:30 - 17:45 0.25 SEQ 1 HANG POWER SWIVEL BACK
17:45 - 18:00 0.25 TRP 14 TRIP OUT 5 STANDS; DRAIN PUMP AND LINES: SHUT IN WELL
18:00 - 19:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN

3/14/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/14/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 -07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING: CHECK PRESSURE SICP= OPSI SITP= OPSI
07:15 -08:30 1.25 TRP 12 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR MUD MOTOR
08:30 - 08:45 0.25 OTH TIE DOUBLE FAST LINE
08:45 - 11:30 2.75 TRP 12 CONTINUE TRIPPING FOR MOTOR : BREAK BIT OFF AND LAY DOWN MUD

MOTOR
11:30 - 13:30 2.00 TRP 2 MAKE UP BIT AND SCRAPER : TRIP IN 262 JTS @8500' TO PUMP ACID
13:30 - 17:15 3.75 STIM i SAFETY MEETING WITH HALLIBURTON: RIG UP ACID CREW: PRESSURE

TEST LINES @5000PSI : PUMP 500GALS 15% EACHSTAGE CIRCULATE TO
SURFACE : STAGE ARE 8500' / 10000' / 11500'/ 12500/ TRIP IN TO EACH
STAGE : DISPLACE WITH 200BBLS 2% KCL WATER: RIG DOWN
HALLIBARTON

17:15 - 17:30 0.25 TRP 5 LAY DOWN 2JTS : SWIFN
17:30 - 19:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN

3/15/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/15/11: TRAVELTO LOCATION

Printed: 4/5/2011 10:08:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

3/10/2011 07:15 - 07:45 0.50 TRP 5 RIG UP PUMP LINES: PICK UP 2JTS: TAG CEMENT @8381'
07:45 - 08:00 i 0.25 SEQ \ 1 RIG UP POWER SWIVEL: CHANGE OUT CROSS OVER.
08:00 - 11:15 3.25 DRL 4 GET CIRCULATION WITH HOLE STANDING FULL:CHANGE OUT

WASHINGTON HEAD RUBBER : START TO DRILL CEMENT @ 8381' PUMP
PRESSURE=900PSI :DRILLTO 8694':

11:15 - 11:30 0.25 OTH TIE BACK TO SINGLE FAST
11:30 - 17:30 6.00 DRL 4 RESUME DRILLING@ 8694:@ 1:30pm PUMP 125BBL SWEEP WHILE

DRILLING:
DRILLTO 9478'

17:30 - 18:30 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP TO CLEAN HOLE OUT FOR THE NIGHT
18:30 - 18:45 0.25 SEQ 1 HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
18:45 - 19:00 0.25 TRP 5 LAYDOWN 2JTS: DRAIN PUMP AND LINES: SWIFN
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN

3/11/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/11/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 -07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING:CHECK PRESSURES SICP= OPSI SITP=0PSI
07:15 - 07:30 0.25 TRP 5 RIG UP PUMP LINES: PICK UP 2JTS TAG CEMENT @9478'
07:30 -07:45 0.25 SEQ 1 PICK UP POWER SWIVEL
07:45 - 17:30 9.75 DRL 4 GET CIRCULATION WITH HOLE STANDING FULL: RESUME DRILLING@9478'

@10:30PUMP 125BBL SWEEP WHILE DRILLING DEPTH @9978'
@2:00PUMP 125BBL SWEEP WHILE DRILLING , DEPTH @10478'
DRILLTO 10976'

17:30 - 18:30 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP TO CLEAN HOLE FOR NIGHT
18:30 - 18:45 0.25 SEQ 1 HANG BACK POWER SWIVEL
18:45 - 19:00 0.25 TRP 5 LAY DOWN 2 JTS: DRAIN PUMP AND LINE SWIFN.
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN

3/12/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/12/11 TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 -07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING; CHECK PRESSURE SICP= OPSI SITP=0PSI
07:15 -07:30 0.25 TRP 5 PICK 2JTS : RIG UP PUMP LINES: CHANGE ELEVATORS
07:30 -07:45 0.25 SEQ 1 RIG UP POWER SWIVEL
07:45 - 16:30 8.75 DRL 4 GET CIRCULATION WITH HOLE STANDING FULL: PUMP PRESSURE 1000PSI

RESUME DRILLING@ 10976 : 10:30 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP WHILE DRILLING
DEPTH 11476'; 1:30 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP WHILE DRILLING DEPTH 11991'
HIT TOTAL DEPTH 11250'

16:30 - 17:30 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP 125BBL SWEEP TO CLEAN WELL OUT
17:30 - 17:45 0.25 SEQ 1 HANG POWER SWIVEL BACK
17:45 - 18:00 0.25 TRP 14 TRIP OUT 5 STANDS; DRAIN PUMP AND LINES: SHUT IN WELL
18:00 - 19:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN

3/14/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/14/11: TRAVEL TO LOCATION
07:00 -07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING: CHECK PRESSURE SICP= OPSI SITP= OPSI
07:15 -08:30 1.25 TRP 12 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR MUD MOTOR
08:30 - 08:45 0.25 OTH TIE DOUBLE FAST LINE
08:45 - 11:30 2.75 TRP 12 CONTINUE TRIPPING FOR MOTOR : BREAK BIT OFF AND LAY DOWN MUD

MOTOR
11:30 - 13:30 2.00 TRP 2 MAKE UP BIT AND SCRAPER : TRIP IN 262 JTS @8500' TO PUMP ACID
13:30 - 17:15 3.75 STIM i SAFETY MEETING WITH HALLIBURTON: RIG UP ACID CREW: PRESSURE

TEST LINES @5000PSI : PUMP 500GALS 15% EACHSTAGE CIRCULATE TO
SURFACE : STAGE ARE 8500' / 10000' / 11500'/ 12500/ TRIP IN TO EACH
STAGE : DISPLACE WITH 200BBLS 2% KCL WATER: RIG DOWN
HALLIBARTON

17:15 - 17:30 0.25 TRP 5 LAY DOWN 2JTS : SWIFN
17:30 - 19:00 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN

3/15/2011 05:30 - 07:00 1.50 TRAV 1 3/15/11: TRAVELTO LOCATION

Printed: 4/5/2011 10:08:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

3/15/2011 07:00 - 07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING : CHEACK PRESSURES SICP= 0 PSI SITP= 0 PSI
07:15 - 10:30 3.25 TRP 5 DRAIN ALL TANKS : RACK OUT PUMPS AND TANKS :LAY DOWN TUBING

201JTS
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 LUN 1 CHANGE FLOAT TRAILERS AND EAT LUNCH
11:00 - 14:00 3.00 TRP 5 LAY DOWN 200JTS OF TUBING BREAK OFF BIT AND SCRAPER
14:00 - 15:30 1.50 BOP 1 RIG DOWN FLOOR : NIPPLE DOWN B.O.P'S: NIPPLE UP WELL AND RELATED

EQUIPMENT
15:30 - 17:00 1.50 LOC 4 RIG DOWN : CLEAN LOCATION : MOVE TRAILS OUT OF THE WAY FOR

WATER HAILERS : PARK RIG ON SIDE OF LOCATION FOR NIGHT
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN

3/21/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 LOG 4 Tight Hole - Initial Completion Report - Rigless
On 3/16/11 - MIRULone Wolf WL & ran a CBLIVDLIGR log fl tag @12500' to 200'
w/ TOC est @ 8850'. Correlated the bond log to the Weatherford Density log dated
2/5/11 (log actually shows 2/5/10). RDMO Lone Wolf.

On 3/17/11 - Cameron changed out 4-1/16" x 5K Tbg Head to 4-1/16" x 10K frac
mandrel. Pressure test frac head assembly & csg to 7000# & held OK. Bled off
well & Si the well.

On 3/18/11 - RU Lone Wolf & perforate MV Interval 12246-56' & 12168-74' per the
CBL log dated 3/16/11@ 3 JPF using a 3-1/8" csg gun & 120* phasing. (48 holes in
zone #1). Hole was full of 25 KCL water prior to perforating & after w/ no pressure
prior to or after. SI the well pending frac work on 3/21/11.

Cag Size: 4-1/2", 11.6#, HCP-P110
Csg Depth: 12626'
PBTD: 12500' (CBL - 3/16/11)

Perfs:
Mesa Verde
Zone #1: 12168-74'; 12246-56'

3/22/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 STIM 3 Tight Hole - Completion - Rigless
3/21/11 - NOTE: AIIthe below fracs are a 2% KCL slick water system using 30/50
sand & all zones were broke down wl 800 gals of 15% HCL acid. All plugs are a
Halliburton Comp. Obsidian Frac Plug. All perforating is done using a 3-1/8" csg
gun @3 JPF & 120* phasing per the CBL log dated 3/16/11. AIIzones are Mesa
Verde.
Zone #1: (12168-74' & 12246-56'): Frac w/ 800 gals of 15% HCL followed by a
10000 gal pad & stage 0.25 to 1.25 ppg sand in 78000 gals of fluid & flush w/ 800
gals of acid & 7560 gals of water. Total of 78700# of sand & a totalof 2690 bbls.
Max rate = 53.6 BPM; avg rate = 53 BPM; Ma× psi = 6300#; avg psi = 5496#; ISIP
= 3381#; (0.72).
Set a frac plug @12140' & perf interval 12050-64' (42 holes).
Zone #2: (12050-64'): Frac w/ a 10000 gal pad & stae 0.25 to 1.25 ppg sand in
150000 gals of fluid & flush w/ 800 gals of acid & 7540 gals of water. Total of
101000# of sand & a total load of 3970 bbis. Max rate = 40.8 BPM; avg rate = 40.5
BPM; Max psi = 5002#; avg psi = 4693#; ISIP = 3514#; (0.73).
Set a frac plug @ 12000'. Perforate intervals 11445-47', 11522-26'; 11608-12' &
11632-38'.
Zone #3: (11445-11638'): Frac w/ a 100000 gal pad & stage 0.25 to 1.25 ppg sand
in 50000 gals of water &flush w/ 7500 gals of water. Total of 49600# of sand & a
totalload of 1800 bbis. Max rate = 52 BPM; avg rate = 50.8 BPM; Max psi =

6323#; avg psi = 5484#, ISIP = 3790# (0.77).

Printed: 4/5/2011 10:08:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

3/15/2011 07:00 - 07:15 0.25 OTH SAFETY MEETING : CHEACK PRESSURES SICP= 0 PSI SITP= 0 PSI
07:15 - 10:30 3.25 TRP 5 DRAIN ALL TANKS : RACK OUT PUMPS AND TANKS :LAY DOWN TUBING

201JTS
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 LUN 1 CHANGE FLOAT TRAILERS AND EAT LUNCH
11:00 - 14:00 3.00 TRP 5 LAY DOWN 200JTS OF TUBING BREAK OFF BIT AND SCRAPER
14:00 - 15:30 1.50 BOP 1 RIG DOWN FLOOR : NIPPLE DOWN B.O.P'S: NIPPLE UP WELL AND RELATED

EQUIPMENT
15:30 - 17:00 1.50 LOC 4 RIG DOWN : CLEAN LOCATION : MOVE TRAILS OUT OF THE WAY FOR

WATER HAILERS : PARK RIG ON SIDE OF LOCATION FOR NIGHT
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 TRAV 1 TRAVEL TO TOWN

3/21/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 LOG 4 Tight Hole - Initial Completion Report - Rigless
On 3/16/11 - MIRULone Wolf WL & ran a CBLIVDLIGR log fl tag @12500' to 200'
w/ TOC est @ 8850'. Correlated the bond log to the Weatherford Density log dated
2/5/11 (log actually shows 2/5/10). RDMO Lone Wolf.

On 3/17/11 - Cameron changed out 4-1/16" x 5K Tbg Head to 4-1/16" x 10K frac
mandrel. Pressure test frac head assembly & csg to 7000# & held OK. Bled off
well & Si the well.

On 3/18/11 - RU Lone Wolf & perforate MV Interval 12246-56' & 12168-74' per the
CBL log dated 3/16/11@ 3 JPF using a 3-1/8" csg gun & 120* phasing. (48 holes in
zone #1). Hole was full of 25 KCL water prior to perforating & after w/ no pressure
prior to or after. SI the well pending frac work on 3/21/11.

Cag Size: 4-1/2", 11.6#, HCP-P110
Csg Depth: 12626'
PBTD: 12500' (CBL - 3/16/11)

Perfs:
Mesa Verde
Zone #1: 12168-74'; 12246-56'

3/22/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 STIM 3 Tight Hole - Completion - Rigless
3/21/11 - NOTE: AIIthe below fracs are a 2% KCL slick water system using 30/50
sand & all zones were broke down wl 800 gals of 15% HCL acid. All plugs are a
Halliburton Comp. Obsidian Frac Plug. All perforating is done using a 3-1/8" csg
gun @3 JPF & 120* phasing per the CBL log dated 3/16/11. AIIzones are Mesa
Verde.
Zone #1: (12168-74' & 12246-56'): Frac w/ 800 gals of 15% HCL followed by a
10000 gal pad & stage 0.25 to 1.25 ppg sand in 78000 gals of fluid & flush w/ 800
gals of acid & 7560 gals of water. Total of 78700# of sand & a totalof 2690 bbls.
Max rate = 53.6 BPM; avg rate = 53 BPM; Ma× psi = 6300#; avg psi = 5496#; ISIP
= 3381#; (0.72).
Set a frac plug @12140' & perf interval 12050-64' (42 holes).
Zone #2: (12050-64'): Frac w/ a 10000 gal pad & stae 0.25 to 1.25 ppg sand in
150000 gals of fluid & flush w/ 800 gals of acid & 7540 gals of water. Total of
101000# of sand & a total load of 3970 bbis. Max rate = 40.8 BPM; avg rate = 40.5
BPM; Max psi = 5002#; avg psi = 4693#; ISIP = 3514#; (0.73).
Set a frac plug @ 12000'. Perforate intervals 11445-47', 11522-26'; 11608-12' &
11632-38'.
Zone #3: (11445-11638'): Frac w/ a 100000 gal pad & stage 0.25 to 1.25 ppg sand
in 50000 gals of water &flush w/ 7500 gals of water. Total of 49600# of sand & a
totalload of 1800 bbis. Max rate = 52 BPM; avg rate = 50.8 BPM; Max psi =

6323#; avg psi = 5484#, ISIP = 3790# (0.77).

Printed: 4/5/2011 10:08:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

3/22/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 STIM 3 Set frac plug @ 11400'. Perforate interval 11300-16' (48 holes). RDMO Lone Wolf
WL.
Zone #4: (11300-16'): Frac w/ a 100000 gal pad & stage 0.25 to 1.25 ppg sand in
105000 gals of fluid & flush w/ 8100 gals of water. Total of 92300# of sand & a total
load of 2670 bbls. Max rate = 53.8 BPM; avg rate = 53.3 BPM; ma× psi = 6413#;
avg psi = 4636#; ISIP = 2420# (0.65).SI the well for 2 hours. RDMO Halliburton.
After a 2 hour SI period SICP = 2550#. Open the well @9:00 PM on 3/21/22 on a
12/64" choke to the pit & continue to flow the csg to the pit overnight. At 6:00 AM
on 3/22/11 - FCP = 2200# on a 16/64" choke w/ a slight trace of sand & no gas w/ a
total recovery est @680 bbls & a current flow rate of 80 BPH. Continue to flow to
the pit to clean up.
NOTE: Sand wedge was used in all sand stages of each interval.

Cag Size: 4-1/2", 11.6#, HCP-P110
Csg Depth: 12626'
PBTD: 12500' (CBL - 3/16/11)

Perfs:
Mesa Verde
Zone #1: 12168-74'; 12246-56'
Zone #2: 12050-64'
Zone #3: 11445-47'; 11522-26'; 11608-12'; 11632-38'
Zone #4 - 11300-16'

FRAC PLUGS ARE AT 12140'; 12000'; 11400'
3/23/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 PTST 2 Tight Hole - Completion - Rigless

3/23/11 - Per instructions continue to flow the well to the pit for the next 24 hours &
at 5:30 AM on 3/23/11 FCP = 2100# on a 10/64" choke at an est rate of 50 BPH &
heavy gas cut w/ some condensate & have recovered an est additional 1040 bbis of
water in the last 24 hours. Continue to flow to the pit this AM. No sand problems.

Cag Size: 4-1/2", 11.6#, HCP-P110
Csg Depth: 12626'
PBTD: 12500' (CBL - 3/16/11)

Perfs:
Mesa Verde
Zone #1: 12168-74'; 12246-56'
Zone #2: 12050-64'
Zone #3: 11445-4T; 11522-26'; 11608-12'; 11632-38'
Zone #4 - 11300-16'

FRAC PLUGS ARE AT 12140'; 12000'; 11400'
3/24/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 PTST 2 Tight Hole - Completion - Rigless

3/24/11 - Continue to flow the well to the pit until 8:00 AM on 3/23/11 & then SI the
well & turnwellover to production. Flowed an additional125 bb1s since 5:30 AM on
3/23/11.

REPORT DISCONTINUED UNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

Cag Size: 4-1/2", 11.6#, HCP-P110
Csg Depth: 12626'

Printed: 4/5/2011 10:08:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

3/22/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 STIM 3 Set frac plug @ 11400'. Perforate interval 11300-16' (48 holes). RDMO Lone Wolf
WL.
Zone #4: (11300-16'): Frac w/ a 100000 gal pad & stage 0.25 to 1.25 ppg sand in
105000 gals of fluid & flush w/ 8100 gals of water. Total of 92300# of sand & a total
load of 2670 bbls. Max rate = 53.8 BPM; avg rate = 53.3 BPM; ma× psi = 6413#;
avg psi = 4636#; ISIP = 2420# (0.65).SI the well for 2 hours. RDMO Halliburton.
After a 2 hour SI period SICP = 2550#. Open the well @9:00 PM on 3/21/22 on a
12/64" choke to the pit & continue to flow the csg to the pit overnight. At 6:00 AM
on 3/22/11 - FCP = 2200# on a 16/64" choke w/ a slight trace of sand & no gas w/ a
total recovery est @680 bbls & a current flow rate of 80 BPH. Continue to flow to
the pit to clean up.
NOTE: Sand wedge was used in all sand stages of each interval.

Cag Size: 4-1/2", 11.6#, HCP-P110
Csg Depth: 12626'
PBTD: 12500' (CBL - 3/16/11)

Perfs:
Mesa Verde
Zone #1: 12168-74'; 12246-56'
Zone #2: 12050-64'
Zone #3: 11445-47'; 11522-26'; 11608-12'; 11632-38'
Zone #4 - 11300-16'

FRAC PLUGS ARE AT 12140'; 12000'; 11400'
3/23/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 PTST 2 Tight Hole - Completion - Rigless

3/23/11 - Per instructions continue to flow the well to the pit for the next 24 hours &
at 5:30 AM on 3/23/11 FCP = 2100# on a 10/64" choke at an est rate of 50 BPH &
heavy gas cut w/ some condensate & have recovered an est additional 1040 bbis of
water in the last 24 hours. Continue to flow to the pit this AM. No sand problems.

Cag Size: 4-1/2", 11.6#, HCP-P110
Csg Depth: 12626'
PBTD: 12500' (CBL - 3/16/11)

Perfs:
Mesa Verde
Zone #1: 12168-74'; 12246-56'
Zone #2: 12050-64'
Zone #3: 11445-4T; 11522-26'; 11608-12'; 11632-38'
Zone #4 - 11300-16'

FRAC PLUGS ARE AT 12140'; 12000'; 11400'
3/24/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 PTST 2 Tight Hole - Completion - Rigless

3/24/11 - Continue to flow the well to the pit until 8:00 AM on 3/23/11 & then SI the
well & turnwellover to production. Flowed an additional125 bb1s since 5:30 AM on
3/23/11.

REPORT DISCONTINUED UNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

Cag Size: 4-1/2", 11.6#, HCP-P110
Csg Depth: 12626'

Printed: 4/5/2011 10:08:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code CS
e Description of Operations

3/24/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 PTST 2 PBTD: 12500' (CBL - 3/16/11)

LLTR: 9435 BBLS

Perfs:
Mesa Verde
Zone #1: 12168-74'; 12246-56'
Zone #2: 12050-64'
Zone #3: 11445-4T; 11522-26'; 11608-12'; 11632-38'
Zone #4 - 11300-16'

FRACPLUGS ARE AT 12140'; 12000'; 11400'

I
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22 Spud Date: 1/9/2011
Location: 18- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code CS
e Description of Operations

3/24/2011 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 PTST 2 PBTD: 12500' (CBL - 3/16/11)

LLTR: 9435 BBLS

Perfs:
Mesa Verde
Zone #1: 12168-74'; 12246-56'
Zone #2: 12050-64'
Zone #3: 11445-4T; 11522-26'; 11608-12'; 11632-38'
Zone #4 - 11300-16'

FRACPLUGS ARE AT 12140'; 12000'; 11400'

I
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU71416 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 KILIMANJARO (DEEP) 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BW 15-18-7-22 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047511790000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UNDESIGNATED 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0626 FSL 1841 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSE Section: 18 Township: 07.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

4/25/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: Wildcat Tax Credit Application

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP Energy Company requests that the wildcat tax credit be applied to the
above well. This is the first well with production from the Mesaverde pool

within a one mile radius at the time of completion (see attached map). The
Mesaverde Formation is at 9745' in the subject wellbore, significantly deeper

than the previously tested wells in the area. Gas production in this part of the
basin has particularly been from shallower horizons and therefore, this well
should be considered wildcat in nature. Offset wells include: SEE ATTACHED

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Valyn Davis 435 781-4369

TITLE
 Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURE
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DATE
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06/16/2011

Apr. 25, 2011

Sundry Number: 14543 API Well Number: 43047511790000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEA751EDE65IGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. KILIMANJARO (DEEP)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well BW 15-18-7-22

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047511790000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 E×t UNDESIGNATED

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0626 FSL 1841 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SWSE Section: 18 Township: 07.05 Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/25/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

/ WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Wildcat Tax Credit Appl

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP Energy Company requests that the wildcat tax credit be applied to the
above well. This is the first well with production from the Mesaverde pool

within a one mile radius at the time of completion (see attached map). The Approved by the
Mesaverde Formation is at 9745' in the subject wellbore, significantly deeper Utah Division of

than the previously tested wells in the area. Gas production in this part of the Oil, Gas and Mining
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The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047511790000

See attached Statement of Basis. 

Apr. 25, 2011

Sundry Number: 14543 API Well Number: 43047511790000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
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Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047511790000

See attached Statement of Basis.
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DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
OTL GAS & M1NTNG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047511790000

See attached Statement of Basis.



Apr. 25, 2011

Sundry Number: 14543 API Well Number: 43047511790000

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING
Wildcat Well Determination

STATEMENT OF BASIS

Applicant: QEP Enerqy Company

Location: SWSE Sec 18 TO70S R220E Uintah county, Utah

WELL NAME: BW 15-18-7-22 API #: 43-047-51179

FINDINGS

1. This well was completed on February 4, 2011 in the Mesa Verde formation, with a
spud date of January 2, 2011 reaching a totaldepth of 12,643 feet.

2. One well in the surrounding 1-mile radius that has produced was completed in the
Wasatch formation. (Attachment A)

3. This well was > 1 mile from any known production in the Mesa Verde Formation at
the time of the start of commercial production. (Attachment A)

4. There has been no production out of the Mesa Verde formation from wells within a
1-mile radius of this well. (See Attachment A for surrounding well information)

CONCLUSIONS

Based on the findings above the Division has determined the BW 15-18-7-22 was
drilled into an unknown area for the Mesa Verde formation. The Division finds that
thiswell qualifies for the severance tax exemption under Section 59-5-102(5)(b) for
wildcat wells. This determination was made in accordance with Oil and Gas
General Conservation Rule R649-3-35. If the operator disagrees with this
determination, the decision may be appealed to the Board of Oil Gas and Mining.

Reviewer(s): Dustin K. Doucet Date: NL (

Joshua J. Payne Date: May 16, 2011

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING
Wildcat Well Determination

STATEMENT OF BASIS

Applicant: QEP Enerqy Company

Location: SWSE Sec 18 TO70S R220E Uintah county, Utah

WELL NAME: BW 15-18-7-22 API #: 43-047-51179

FINDINGS

1. This well was completed on February 4, 2011 in the Mesa Verde formation, with a
spud date of January 2, 2011 reaching a totaldepth of 12,643 feet.

2. One well in the surrounding 1-mile radius that has produced was completed in the
Wasatch formation. (Attachment A)

3. This well was > 1 mile from any known production in the Mesa Verde Formation at
the time of the start of commercial production. (Attachment A)

4. There has been no production out of the Mesa Verde formation from wells within a
1-mile radius of this well. (See Attachment A for surrounding well information)

CONCLUSIONS

Based on the findings above the Division has determined the BW 15-18-7-22 was
drilled into an unknown area for the Mesa Verde formation. The Division finds that
thiswell qualifies for the severance tax exemption under Section 59-5-102(5)(b) for
wildcat wells. This determination was made in accordance with Oil and Gas
General Conservation Rule R649-3-35. If the operator disagrees with this
determination, the decision may be appealed to the Board of Oil Gas and Mining.

Reviewer(s): Dustin K. Doucet Date: NL (

Joshua J. Payne Date: May 16, 2011



Apr. 25, 2011

Sundry Number: 14543 API Well Number: 43047511790000
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Sundry Number: 14543 API Well Number: 43047511790000
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United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT TAKE Pator*

ca Utah State Office '"AM MCA

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180 (UTU88205A)
UT-922

AUG- 5 2011
Nathan C. Koeniger
QEP Energy Company
1050 17* Street, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265

Re: Initial Wasatch-Mesaverde Formation
Participating Area "A"
Kilimanjaro (Deep) Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Dear Mr. Koeniger:

The initial Wasatch-Mesaverde Formation Participating Area "A", Kilimanjaro (Deep) Unit,
UTU88205A, is hereby approved effective as of March 23, 2011, pursuant to Section 11 of the
Kilimanjaro (Deep) Unit Agreement, Uintah County, Utah.

The Initial Wasatch-Mesaverde Formation Participating Area "A"results in an Initial participating
area of 40.00 acres and is based upon the completion of Well No. BW 15-18-7-22, API No. 43-047-
51179, located in the SW¼SE¼, of Section 18, Township 7 South, Range22 East, SLM&B, Federal
Unit Tract No. 11, Lease No. UTU71416, as being a well capable of producing unitized substances
in paying quantities.

For production and accounting reporting purposes, all submissions pertaining to the InitialWasatch-
Mesaverde Formation Participating Area "A"shall refer to UTU88205A.

Copies of the approved request are being distributed to the appropriate agencies. Please advise all
interested parties of the establishment of the initial Wasatch-Mesaverde Formation Participating
Area "A", Kilimanjaro (Deep) Unit, and the effective date.

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals

cc: UDOGM
SITLA
ONRR w/Exhibit B (Attn: Leona Reilly)
BLM FOM - Vernal

United States Department of the Interior
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STATE OF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISlONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: QEP ENERGY COMPANY Operator Account Number: N 3700

Address: 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

city VERNAL

state UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4369

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

4304751179 BW 15-18-7-22 SWSE 18 7S 22E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Ässignrient
Number Number Effective Date

C 17912 1/2/2011 3/1/2011

Comments:

Well 2
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

4304734403 SU BRENNAN W 15W-18-7-22 SWSE 18 7S 22E UINTAH

Action Cod Cu rent Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effecnve Date

C 13442 3/21/2002 ) g
Comments: ÍÂÔ

Well 3
API Number Well Name QQ See Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Valyn Davis

B - Add newwell to existing entity (groupor unitwell) teasePrin

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity si nature

E - Other (Explain in 'comments section)RECEIVED
Ê.gulatAffairs Analyst D7a/t30/2012

-> JUL 3 0 2012
Div.ofOil.Gas&

STATE OF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISlONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM
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Div.ofOil.Gas&
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STATE OF UTAH FORM6

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIOWOF011.,GÃSANDMINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: QEP Energy Company Operator Account Number: N 3700

Address: 11002 East 17500 South

city Vernal

state UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4342

Well i
ARI Number a ' Well Name QQ See Twp Rng:

, County ,

4304751179 BW 15-18-7-22 SWSE 18 7S 22E Uintah

Action Code ' i :Current Entity NeÀEntity Sp d Date Entity Assignnient
Ñumber, Number Effective Date

99999 1/3/2011 |

ÄÑÌÑuinber b ' WelÙlame , QQ Sec Twp Rng ,
= County

Action Code Current Entity Ne Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number r Number .

Effective Date

Comments:

WellAPI
Number ," Well Name " QQ See Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity J , New Entity Sp d Date I¯ntity Assignment '

, Number i Number 'n .
Effective Date '

Comments:
RECE1VED
JANO4 2011

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish new entity for newwell (single vglijp )0\L,GAS&MI ahn Caldwell

B - Add new wellto existingentity (groupor unit well) Na t
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity toa new entity signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Office Adminstrator 1/4/2011

Title Date

e 4
STATE OF UTAH FORM6

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIOWOF011.,GÃSANDMINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: QEP Energy Company Operator Account Number: N 3700

Address: 11002 East 17500 South

city Vernal

state UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4342

Well i
ARI Number a ' Well Name QQ See Twp Rng:

, County ,

4304751179 BW 15-18-7-22 SWSE 18 7S 22E Uintah

Action Code '
i :Current Entity NeÀEntity Sp d Date Entity Assignnient

Ñumber, Number Effective Date

99999 1/3/2011 |

ÄÑÌÑuinber b ' WelÙlame , QQ Sec Twp Rng ,
= County

Action Code Current Entity Ne Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number r Number .

Effective Date

Comments:

WellAPI
Number ," Well Name " QQ See Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity J , New Entity Sp d Date I¯ntity Assignment '

, Number i Number 'n .
Effective Date '

Comments:
RECE1VED
JANO4 2011

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish new entity for newwell (single vglijp )0\L,GAS&MI ahn Caldwell

B - Add new wellto existingentity (groupor unit well) Na t
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity toa new entity signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Office Adminstrator 1/4/2011

Title Date



RECEIVED: Jun. 10, 2014

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU71416 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 KILIMANJARO (DEEP) 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BW 15-18-7-22 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047511790000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UNDESIGNATED 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0626 FSL 1841 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSE Section: 18 Township: 07.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

7 /1 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP ENERGY COMPANY REQUESTS APPROVAL TO RECOMPLETE THE BW
15-18-7-22 BY ADDING PERFORATIONS TO THE EXISTING MESA VERDE

FORMATION AS FOLLOWS: 1. SET A CBP AT 11,275'. 2. STAGE 1:
11,087'-11,238', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 3. SET A

CBP AT 11,065'. 4. STAGE 2: 10,902'-11,039', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT,
FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 5. SET A CBP AT 10,880'. 6. STAGE 3:

10,652'-10,848', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 7. DRILL
OUT THE TOP TWO PLUGS, BUT LEAVE THE BOTTOM PLUG. 8. RETURN

WELL TO PRODUCTION. 9. THE BOTTOM PLUG WILL BE REMOVED ONCE
THE PRESSURE FROM THE FRAC DECREASES. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Benna Muth 435 781-4320

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6 /10 /2014

June 12, 2014

Sundry Number: 52087 API Well Number: 43047511790000Sundry Number: 52087 API Well Number: 43047511790000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU71416

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. KILIMANJARO(DEEP)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well BW 15-18-7-22

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047511790000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext UNDESIGNATED

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0626 FSL 1841 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWSE Section: 18 Township: 07.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

7/1/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGYCOMPANYREQUESTS APPROVALTO RECOMPLETETHE BW Accepted by the
15-18-7-22 BY ADDING PERFORATIONS TO THE EXISTING MESA VERDE utah Division of

FORMATION AS FOLLOWS: 1. SET A CBP AT 11,275'. 2. STAGE 1: June'1 ing

11,087'-11,238', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 3. SET A Date:
CBP AT 11,065'. 4. STAGE 2: 10,902'-11,039', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT,

FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 5. SET A CBP AT 10,880'. 6. STAGE 3: sy: \ As/\
10,652'-10,848', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 7. DRILL

OUT THE TOP TWO PLUGS, BUT LEAVETHE BOTTOM PLUG. 8. RETURN
WELL TO PRODUCTION. 9. THE BOTTOM PLUG WILLBE REMOVED ONCE

THE PRESSURE FROMTHE FRAC DECREASES.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Benna Muth 435 781-4320 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/10/2014

RECEIVED: Jun. 10,

Sundry Number: 52087 API Well Number: 43047511790000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU71416

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. KILIMANJARO(DEEP)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well BW 15-18-7-22

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047511790000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext UNDESIGNATED

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0626 FSL 1841 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWSE Section: 18 Township: 07.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

7/1/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGYCOMPANYREQUESTS APPROVALTO RECOMPLETETHE BW Accepted by the
15-18-7-22 BY ADDING PERFORATIONS TO THE EXISTING MESA VERDE utah Division of

FORMATION AS FOLLOWS: 1. SET A CBP AT 11,275'. 2. STAGE 1: June'1 ing

11,087'-11,238', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 3. SET A Date:
CBP AT 11,065'. 4. STAGE 2: 10,902'-11,039', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT,

FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 5. SET A CBP AT 10,880'. 6. STAGE 3: sy: \ As/\
10,652'-10,848', 3 SHOTS PER FOOT, FRAC WITH SLICKWATER. 7. DRILL

OUT THE TOP TWO PLUGS, BUT LEAVETHE BOTTOM PLUG. 8. RETURN
WELL TO PRODUCTION. 9. THE BOTTOM PLUG WILLBE REMOVED ONCE

THE PRESSURE FROMTHE FRAC DECREASES.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Benna Muth 435 781-4320 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/10/2014

RECEIVED: Jun. 10,



RECEIVED: Jan. 19, 2015

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU71416 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 KILIMANJARO (DEEP) 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 BW 15-18-7-22 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QEP ENERGY COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047511790000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UNDESIGNATED 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0626 FSL 1841 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSE Section: 18 Township: 07.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

8 /6 /2014

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 QEP ENERGY COMPANY RECOMPLETED THE BW 15-18-7-22 ON
08/06/2014 BY ADDING PERFORATIONS TO THE EXISTING MESA VERDE
FORMATION AS FOLLOWS: STAGE 1. 11,087' - 11,238' WITH 48 SHOTS
AT 3 SHOTS PER FOOT; STAGE 2. 10,902' - 11,039' WITH 48 SHOTS AT
3 SHOTS PER FOOT; STAGE 3. 10,652' - 10,848' WITH 48 SHOTS AT 3

SHOTS PER FOOT, USING 13,301.1 BBLS SLICKWATER AND 354,640 LBS
30/50 SAND. WELL WAS RETURNED TO PRODUCTION ON 08/10/2014.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Benna Muth 435 781-4320

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 1 /19 /2015

January 27, 2015

Sundry Number: 59974 API Well Number: 43047511790000Sundry Number: 59974 API Well Number: 43047511790000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU71416

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. KILIMANJARO(DEEP)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well BW 15-18-7-22

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
QEP ENERGY COMPANY 43047511790000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, Ut, 84078 303 308-3068 Ext UNDESIGNATED

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0626 FSL 1841 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWSE Section: 18 Township: 07.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/6/20 14
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP ENERGY COMPANY RECOMPLETED THE BW 15-18-7-22 ON Accepted by the
08/06/2014 BY ADDING PERFORATIONS TO THE EXISTING MESA VERDE Utah Division of
FORMATION AS FOLLOWS: STAGE 1. 11,087' - 11,238' WITH 48 SHOTS Oil, Gas and Mining

AT 3 SHOTS PER FOOT; STAGE 2. 10,902' - 11,039' WITH 48 SHOTS AT FOR RECORD ONLY
3 SHOTS PER FOOT; STAGE 3. 10,652' - 10,848' WITH 48 SHOTS AT 3 January 27, 2015

SHOTS PER FOOT, USING 13,301.1 BBLS SLICKWATER AND 354,640 LBS
30/50 SAND. WELL WAS RETURNED TO PRODUCTION ON 08/10/2014.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Benna Muth 435 781-4320 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 1/19/2015

RECEIVED: Jan. 19,



RECEIVED: Jan. 19, 2015

Sundry Number: 59974 API Well Number: 43047511790000Sundry Number: 59974 API Well Number: 43047511790000

Daily Summary

QEP Energy Company

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22
API Surface Legal Location Field Name County State Well ConfigurationType
43-047-51179 S18-T7S-R22E BASER WASH UINTAH UTAH Vertical
Unique Well la Ground Elevation (ft) Casing Flange Elevatiori (ft) Current KB to GL (ft) KB to CF (ft) SpuclDate Dry HoleTD Date
UT101812 5,151 5,151.00 14.00 14.00 1/9/2011 19:00 5/11/2011 00:00

RPT# Start Date End Date Summary
1 7/2312014 7/24/2014 7/23/14: Road rig & equipment 7 miles to location. Spot in & rig up. X-O to 2 3/8" tubing equipment. SDFN

2 7/24/2014 7/25/2014 7/24/14: Top killtubingwith 30 bbis. ND well head. NU 5k bap's. RU floor. Pooh LD 351 joint's of 2 3/8" L-
80 tubing, Top killwell as needed with 40 bbl's of 2 %kclwater to control gas flow. Continued topach LD
remaining 49 joint's af2 3/8" L-80 tubing,F-nipple, i jointof 2 3/8" L-80 tubing, Pump off bit sub remains.
RD floor. ND 5k bop's. NU7 1/16 5K frac tree. SWIFN

3 7/25/2014 7126/2014 7/25/14: SICP=500. MIRU Cutters wire line. RIH with 3.625 gage ring down to 11 286'. RIH set4 1/2" 10k
flow though frac plug @11,275'. RD wire line. Fill hale with 145 bbl's of 2% kcl water. Pressure test to
4800 #psi. Good test. Bleed off. SW1FN. RDMO

4 7/30/2014 7/31/2014 7/30/14: SICP-2750 psi. Blow well down. Remove topfrac valve and install stinger assembly. Attempted
to pressure test frac plug, casing, and stinger assembly, but pressure bled from 8500 psi to 0 psi in 5
minutes. RU wireline and RIHwith new frac plug and set at 11,273'. POOH with wireline. Load hole with
110 barrels of fresh water and pressure test to 8,300 psi for 10 minutes (goodtest). RlH with w[reline and
perf stage #1. POOH and RD wireline. Install frac head, RD stinger crew. Shut well in until frac.

5 8/6/2014 Bl7/2014 815/14: MIRU Halliburton frac crew. Frac well per design
6 8/7/2014 8/8/2014 8/7/14: Road rig & equipment 24 miles to location. Spot [n& rig up. X-Oto 2 3/8" tubing equipment. Check

S1CP=0. NDfrac tree. NU Sk bop &hydrill.MIRU B & C quick test &pressure test ram's to 4500 #psi &
HydrÍllto 3500 #psi. RD test truck.RU floor. Spot in & RU pump and lines, Tubing trailer.SWIFN

7 8/8/2014 8/9/2014 8/8/14: Tally & pick up pump off bit sub & 220 joint's of 2 3/8" L-80 tubing. Tag up on frac plug #1 @7010'.
RU swivel & rig pump. Fill hole w[th 27 bbi's of 2% kc1water. Tubing pressure up to 1000 #psi with no circ.
Tubing plugged. stand swivel back & pooh with 220 joint's of 2 3/8" L-80 tubing. Pump off bit sub & F-
nipple was plugged with rust. Tally &make up new pump off bit sub, F-nipple & RlH wÍth 220 jalnt's of
tubing.RU sw vel & pump. Fillhole with28 bbi of 2% kol water to break circ. Drill kill plug outin 15 min.
Take a kick of 1900 #psi on pump &at surface. Stand swivel back. Continued to tally& pick up tubing.
EOT @7965'.Shut tubing [n. Turn well over to flow back crew fro night with a flow rate of 100 BPH. Rig
crew SDFN

8 819/2014 8/10/2014 8/9/14: FCP-1200 #psi on a 19164 choke. Continued to tally& pick up tubing. Tag up on frac plug@10,8802.RU swivel &pump. Fill tubing with 12 bbl's. Drill plug out in 20 min. Swivel in tag up on frac plug@11,0656.Drillout plug in 20 min. Run 2-6k wob, swivel rpm 116, Pump rate 2.5 bpm with 750 #psi.
Swivel in tag up on frac plug #3 @11,263.5'.Pooh LD 3 joint's. Make up tubing hanger & land in well head,
EOT @11,169'.RO swivel & floor. ND hydrill &bap's. NU well head & flow line. Shut well n. RDMO turn
well over to production. Move rig & equipment 2 miles. Spot rigto side of location, SDFN

9 8/25/2014 8/26/2014 08/25/2014: Road rg 11.5 miles, MIRU Basin Swabbing #3. FCP = 300# psl. Spot in equipment. Change
equipment over for2 3/8 tbg. SDFN

10 8/26/2014 8/27/2014 08126/2014: ND well head. NU bops, RU floor and tbg equipment. PU 2 jts. Tag @11210'. 53'of sand an
plug. RU swivel. Pump 60 BBL's of 2 % KCL and kill well. Pump add tional 200 BBL's w/ no returns. LD 2
jts. Shut in the tbg. Casing is up sales line. SDFN w/ EOT @11158'

11 8/27/2014 8/28/2014 08/27/2014: Get circulation wl foaming unit. UN load well. Clean out 53' of sand from 11210' to 11268'
Drillout 2 plugs @11268' 11270' in 1.75 hrs. wl 2 - 4 k on mill. W/ 1500# pumping 20 GPM w/ foaming
unit Turning 100 rpm's. Pump 15 BBL's tbg kill.Hung back swivet. Pull string float. Talley, rabbit, RlH w/
15 Jts Tag @ 11770' PU sw vel. Pump down tbg wi foaming unit. Get foam to mill.Clean out 2' Lose
returns. Pump for 2.5 hrs. No returns. Pump tbg kill.Hang back swivel. Pull string float. LD 4 jts. MU
hanger w/ sub. Land well wl EOT @ 11656' Close p[pe rams and annular bag. Shut in tbg. Tum well over
to production.

12 8/28/2014 8/29/2014 08/28/2014: ND baps, NUwell head. Rack out equipment. RDMO.
13 9/4/2014 9/5/2014 09/04/2014: Road rig 9 miles. MIRU.Nd well head. NU B¤p's. RU floor and tbg equipment. Pull tbg

hanger. RU power swivel and pump lins. Shut p[p rams and annlur bag. Close TIW. Casing is up sales
l[ne. SOFN

14 9/5/2014 9/6/2014 09/05/2014: . RIH w/4Jts Tag @ 11759', RU foaming unit. Try to get circulâtion wl1 unit. RU 2nd unit @
11:30 Got circulation @ 13:00 Clean to sand from 11759' to 12211' Plug is wrapped around m[II.Work Tbg
try to get plug off w/ no success. Pump 15 bbl tbg kill. LD w/ 6 Jts Shut pipe rams and annular Close TiW.
Turn casing up sales line. SDFN EOT @ 12032'. Pump 300 BBL's total

15 9/8/2014 9/9/2014 09/08/2014: Bleed well down to flow back tank. Pump 10 bbl's down tbg. RIH and tag @ 12217 Get
c[rculation wl 2 foaming units Bottom perf @ 12256' Clean out from í2211' to 12234' w/ 2 - 8 k on mill .

Pumping w/2 foaming units w/ 1950#on each. Turning 110 Rpm's. @ 12234' could not get mill to drill.
Made no progress in 1 1/2 hr's Pump tog. Hang back swivel. Pull string float. POOH wltbg. Note: pump off
the bit. SWIFN

QEP Energy Company Page 1/2 Report Printed:



RECEIVED: Jan. 19, 2015

Sundry Number: 59974 API Well Number: 43047511790000Sundry Number: 59974 API Well Number: 43047511790000

Daily Summary

QEP Energy Company

Well Name: BW 15-18-7-22
API Surface Legal Location FieldName County State Well ConfigurationType
43-047-51179 S18-T7S-R22E BASER WASH UINTAH UTAH Vedical
UriiqueWell tD Ground Elevation (ft) Caslng Flange Elevation (ft) Current KB to GL (it} KBto CF (ft) Spud Date DryHole TD Date
UT101812 5,151 5,151.00 14.00 14.00 1/9/2011 19:00 5/11/2011 00:00

RPT # Start Date End Date Summary
16 9/9/2014 9/10/2014 09/09/2014: MUover shot wi2 1/2 Grapple, bumper sub, X-O, RICH w/ 356 Jts of 2 3/8 L-80 Tbg. Tag @

11200' Tryseveral times to work pass w/ no success. POOH wl 356 Jts of 2 3/8 L-80 Tbg and fishing
tools.R1Hwl 5 b ades insert carbine mill,Bft sub, RlH wl 185 jts SWIFNWI EOT @5827 Pump 75 BBL's
of 2% KCL to control well.

17 9/10/2014 9/11/2014 09/10/2014: Bleed well down to flow back tank.Purnp 20 bbis kill. R1Hwltbg Tag @ 11267 RU power
swivel. Get circulation wl2 Foaming unit. Ream on tightspot fro 1126T w/ 2 - 4 k on mill. Turning 80 rpm's
w/1900# psi on foaming units. Clear tight spot in 1 hr. PlJ 2 jts hang back swivel. PU 12 Jts POOH wl15
Jts Pump 15 BBL kill. Pull string float. RIHwl27 Jts Tag @12181'. RU swivel Try to get circulation w/
foaming units Killwell 45 min in to pumping. Pump tbg kill. POOH wl6 Jts SW1FM w/ EOT @ 11999'.

18 9/11/2014 9/12/2014 09/11/2014: Weatherford got circulationwi foaming units by 7:00 A.m. RIH w/ 6 Jts. PU Swivel and broke
1"fitting. Fix swivel. Fish @ 12234' Bottom perf @ 12256" Clean out from 12181' to 12234' w/2 to 4 k on
mill. Wl1900#psi. On foaming unit.Tuming 80 rpm's. Roll hele clean POOH w/ tbg , bit sub and mill. RIH
wl 3 ¾ over shot w/ 2 ½ grapple, bumper sub and tbg to put EOT @ 3652' SWIFN. 309 BBLs recovered,
Pump 200 BBL's Gain of 109 BBL's

19 9/12/2014 9/13/2014 09/12/2014: . Cont[nue to RlH w/ 135 Jts of 2 3 /8 L-80 tbg. Pumping 85 BBLs to control tbg. Pump 50
bbis down tbg . w/ 100 # psi. Stack out 6 k on to fish. Pressure up to 400# psi. PU and set down 10 k. On
to fish. POOH w/ tbg & LD fish. RLHw/ 3 5/8 hurricane mill, Pump off bit sub. F- Nipple, 379 Jts of 2 3/8 L-
80 Tbg. SWIFN wl EOT @12030' 110 BBL'sNon recovered

20 9/15/2014 9/16/2014 09/15/2014: RIH wl5 Jts. Tag @ 12180' PU power swiveL Bottom perfs @12256'. Clean outfrom 12180'
to 12257. W/ 4-8k on mill Pumping wl2 foaming units wl1900#psi, Tuming 100RPM's. Last 2 hrs. Made
no progress. POOHw/8 Jts. Pump 15 BBL'stbg kill . Pull string float. MU tbg hanger. Land well w/ EOT
@ 12040' ND bops, Drop ball, NU well head. Pump off bit wl60 BBL's with no pressure. Shut in well.
RDMO. Final report
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