
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

  
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME and NUMBER

CWU 1400-32X 

2. TYPE OF WORK

DRILL NEW WELL     REENTER P&A WELL     DEEPEN WELL  
3. FIELD OR WILDCAT

NATURAL BUTTES  

4. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well             Coalbed Methane Well: NO 

5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
CHAPITA WELLS  

6. NAME OF OPERATOR
EOG Resources, Inc. 

7. OPERATOR PHONE
435 781-9111 

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR
1060 East Highway 40, Vernal, UT, 84078 

9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
kaylene_gardner@eogresources.com 

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER
(FEDERAL, INDIAN, OR STATE)

ML3355 

11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP

FEDERAL    INDIAN    STATE    FEE  
12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP

FEDERAL    INDIAN    STATE    FEE  

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee')
  

14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')
 

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')

 

18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

YES  (Submit Commingling Application)    NO  

19. SLANT
  

VERTICAL   DIRECTIONAL   HORIZONTAL  

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 1105 FSL   2631 FWL SESW 32 9.0 S 23.0 E S 

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 1105 FSL   2631 FWL SESW 32 9.0 S 23.0 E S 

At Total Depth 1105 FSL   2631 FWL SESW 32 9.0 S 23.0 E S 

21. COUNTY
UINTAH  

22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet)
1105 

23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
640 

 
 

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL
(Applied For Drilling or Completed)

600 

26. PROPOSED DEPTH
MD: 8830     TVD: 8830 

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL

5281 

28. BOND NUMBER

6196017 

29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

49-225 

ATTACHMENTS
 

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES
 

 WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER  COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY

DRILLED)

TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP

NAME Kaylene Gardner TITLE Regulatory Administrator PHONE 435 781-9111 

SIGNATURE DATE 09/11/2009 EMAIL kaylene_gardner@eogresources.com 

API NUMBER ASSIGNED

    43047507660000

    
Permit Manager 

APPROVAL

FORM 3

AMENDED REPORT

API Well No: 43047507660000     Received: 9/11/2009API Well No: 43047507660000 Received: 9/11/2009

FORM 3
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL 1. WELL NAME and NCUWMB1E4ROO-32X

2. TYPE OF WORK 3. FIELD OR WILDCAT
DRILL NEW WELL REENTER P&A WELL DEEPEN WELL NATURAL BUTTES

4. TYPE OF WELL 5. UNIT or COMMUNITIZATION AGREEMENT NAME
Gas Well Coalbed Methane Well: NO CHAPITA WELLS

6. NAME OF OPERATOR 7. OPERATOR PHONE
EOG Resources, Inc. 435 781-9111

8. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 9. OPERATOR E-MAIL
1060 East Highway 40, Vernal, UT, 84078 kaylene_gardner@eogresources.com

10. MINERAL LEASE NUMBER 11. MINERAL OWNERSHIP 12. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
(FEDERAL, INDIAN, OR SM

FEDERAL INDIAN STATE FEE FEDERAL INDIAN STATE I FEE I

13. NAME OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 14. SURFACE OWNER PHONE (if box 12 = 'fee')

15. ADDRESS OF SURFACE OWNER (if box 12 = 'fee') 16. SURFACE OWNER E-MAIL (if box 12 = 'fee')

17. INDIAN ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME 18. INTEND TO COMMINGLE PRODUCTION FROM 19. SLANT

(if box 12 = 'INDIAN')
MULTIPLE FORMATIONS

YES I (Submit Commingling Application) NO l' VERTICALI DIRECTIONAL I HORIZONTAL

20. LOCATION OF WELL FOOTAGES QTR-QTR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE MERIDIAN

LOCATION AT SURFACE 1105 FSL 2631 FWL SESW 32 9.0 S 23.0 E S

Top of Uppermost Producing Zone 1105 FSL 2631 FWL SESW 32 9.0 S 23.0 E S

At Total Depth 1105 FSL 2631 FWL SESW 32 9.0 S 23.0 E S

21. COUNTY 22. DISTANCE TO NEAREST LEASE LINE (Feet) 23. NUMBER OF ACRES IN DRILLING UNIT
UINTAH 1105 640

25. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL IN SAME POOL 26. PROPOSED DEPTH(Applied For Drilling or Completed) MD: 8830 TVD: 8830
600

27. ELEVATION - GROUND LEVEL 28. BOND NUMBER 29. SOURCE OF DRILLING WATER /
WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL NUMBER IF APPLICABLE

5281 6196017 49-225

ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

AFFIDAVIT OF STATUS OF SURFACE OWNER AGREEMENT (IF FEE SURFACE) FORM 5. IF OPERATOR IS OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY PLAN (IF DIRECTIONALLY OR HORIZONTALLY TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP
DRILLED)

NAME Kaylene Gardner TITLE Regulatory Administrator PHONE 435 781-9111

SIGNATURE DATE 09/11/2009 EMAIL kaylene_gardner@eogresources.com

API NUMBER ASSIGNED APPROVAL

43047507660000

Permit



Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)   

Prod 7.875 4.5 0 9050   

Pipe Grade Length Weight    

 Grade N-80 LT&C 8830 11.6    

       

API Well No: 43047507660000     Received: 9/11/2009API Well No: 43047507660000 Received: 9/11/2009

Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)

Prod 7.875 4.5 0 9050

Pipe Grade Length Weight

Grade N-80 LT&C 8830



Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)   

Surf 12.25 9.625 0 2300   

Pipe Grade Length Weight    

 Grade J-55 ST&C 2300 36.0    

       

API Well No: 43047507660000     Received: 9/11/2009API Well No: 43047507660000 Received: 9/11/2009

Proposed Hole, Casing, and Cement

String Hole Size Casing Size Top (MD) Bottom (MD)

Surf 12.25 9.625 0 2300

Pipe Grade Length Weight

Grade J-55 ST&C 2300



’A
PI

W
el

lN
o:

43
04

75
07

66
00

00
’

T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M EOG RESOURCES, INC.
Well location, CWU #1400-32X, located as shown

SB956'JJ"W - 26]EJJ' (Meas.) SB956'27"W - 2640.72' (Meos.) in the SE 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section 32, T9S, R23E,
A L A k S.L.B.&M., Uintah County, Utah.

Brass Cop 1977 Bross Cop, 1977 Bross Cop
0.4' High, Steel in Center of 20'
soa, Frie or stones, sige me or stones BASIS OF ELEVATION
Steel Post 10' SL Y

BENCHMARK 58 EAM (1965) LOCATED IN THE NE 1/4 OF
SECTION 30, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE RED
WASH SE, QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY 7.5 MINUTE
QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 5132 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
LINE TABLE BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

LINE DIRECTION LENGTH
L1 NOO°30'28"W 1104.89'

1977H
h, P 1977 Brass Cop

of Stones 0.4' High, P//e

32 of Stones

o o o
o o o- L -

CWU /1400- J2X
E/ev. Graded Unground = 5281 SC A LE

2631' I CERTIFICATE
LAND

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE D
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS M OR UNDER
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME A U O
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIE

1977 Bross Cop 1977 Bross Cop 1977 Bross Cop 1.J'

08' High, Pile of 0.2' High, Pile of High, Red Steel Post,
REGIST DL DS ORT9S

A
LStones, Steel Post Stones, Stee/ Post Pile of Stones

REGISTR

T10S ss259'46"w - 2647-28' 58956'03"w - 263537' ÚUS * REVISED: 08-18-09 STATE o E Œ

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINGBASIS OF BEARINGS
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.
CD 435 789-1017

LEGEND: (NAD 83)
SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

LATITUDE=
39°59'17.79" (39.988275) 1" = 1000' 04-28-08 05-28-08

=
90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE=

109°21'02.66" (109.350739)
PARTY REFERENCES

(NAD 27) C.R C.M C.H G.L.O. PLATO = PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE=
39°59'17.91" (39.988308)

A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE=
109°21'00.22" (109.350061)

WEATHER

WARM
FILEEOG

RESOURCES,



EIGHT POINT PLAN 

 

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1400-32X 

SE/SW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.. 

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH 

8 point plan-EOG 1 9/11/2009  

 

 

 

1. & 2.   ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES: 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

                 
Estimated TD:  8,830’ or 200’± below TD   Anticipated BHP:  4,712 Psig 

 
1. Fresh Waters may exist in the upper, approximately 1,000 ft ± of the Green River Formation,  

with top at about 2,000 ft ±. 
2. Cement isolation is installed to surface of the well isolating all zones by cement. 

 

3.   PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT:       Production Hole – 5000 Psig 

                                                                               BOP schematic diagrams attached. 

 

4.   CASING PROGRAM: 

                           

 
Note:  12-¼” surface hole will be drilled to a total depth of 200’± below the base of the Green River lost 

circulation zone and cased w/9-⅝” as shown to that depth.  Drilled depth may be shallower or deeper than 

the 2300’ shown above depending on the actual depth of the loss zone. 

 

All casing will be new or inspected. 

 

 

FORMATION TVD-RKB (ft) Objective Lithology  

Green River 1,544  Shale  

Mahogany Oil Shale Bed 2,116  Shale  

Wasatch 4,369 Primary Sandstone Gas 

Chapita Wells 4,924 Primary Sandstone Gas 

Buck Canyon 5,618 Primary Sandstone Gas 

North Horn 6,189 Primary Sandstone Gas 

KMV Price River 6,473 Primary Sandstone Gas 

KMV Price River Middle 7,360 Primary Sandstone Gas 

KMV Price River Lower 8,137 Primary Sandstone Gas 

Sego 8,622  Sandstone  

TD 8,830    

CASING 

Hole 

Size 

Length Size WEIGHT       Grade Thread Rating 

Collapse 

Factor 

Burst 

 

Tensile 

Conductor 20” 40 – 60’ 14”         32.5# S252   1880 PSI 10,000# 

Surface 12 ¼” 

 

0 – 2,300’ KB±    
 

9-⅝” 

 

36.0# 

 

J-55 

 

STC 

 

2020 PSI 

 

3520 Psi 

 

394,000# 

Production 7-7/8”        Surface – TD     4-½” 11.6# N-80 LTC 6350 PSI 7780 Psi 223,000# 

          

’APIWellNo:43047507660000’'APIWellNo:43047507660000'

EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1400-32X
SEISW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M..

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION TVD-RKB (ft) Objective Lithology
Green River 1,544 Shale

Mahogany Oil Shale Bed 2,116 Shale
Wasatch 4,369 Primary Sandstone Gas

Chapita Wells 4,924 Primary Sandstone Gas
Buck Canyon 5,618 Primary Sandstone Gas

North Horn 6,189 Primary Sandstone Gas
KMVPrice River 6,473 Primary Sandstone Gas

KMVPrice River Middle 7,360 Primary Sandstone Gas
KMVPrice River Lower 8,137 Primary Sandstone Gas

Sego 8,622 Sandstone
TD 8,830

Estimated TD: 8,830' or 200'± below TD Anticipated BHP: 4,712 Psiq

1. Fresh Waters may exist in the upper, approximately 1,000 ft ± of the Green River Formation,
with top at about 2,000 ft ±.

2. Cement isolation is installed to surface of the well isolating all zones by cement.

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: Production Hole -5000 Psig
BOP schematic diagrams attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:

M Length M WEIGHT Grade Thread Rating Factor
CASING g Collause Burst Tensile

Conductor 20" 40 - 60' 14" 32.5# S252 1880 PSI 10,000#

Surface 12 ¾" 0 -2,300' KB± 9-¾" 36.0# J-55 STC 2020 PSI 3520 Psi 394,000#
Production 7-7/8" Surface - TD 4-½" 11.6# N-80 LTC 6350 PSI 7780 Psi 223,000#

Note: 12-¾" surface hole will be drilled to a total depth of 200'± below the base of the Green River lost
circulation zone and cased wl9-¾" as shown to that depth. Drilled depth may be shallower or deeper than
the 2300' shown above depending on the actual depth of the loss zone.

AII casinq will be new or inspected.

8 point plan-EOG 1



EIGHT POINT PLAN 

 

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1400-32X 

SE/SW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.. 

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH 

8 point plan-EOG 2 9/11/2009  

 

 

 

 

5.  Float Equipment: 

 
Surface Hole Procedure (0’- 2300’±) 

 
  Guide Shoe 
  Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable) 

Centralizers:  1-5’ above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5
th
 joint to surface.  (15 total) 

 

Production Hole Procedure (2300’± - TD): 

 
Float shoe, 1 joint casing, float collar and balance of casing to surface.  4-½”, 11.6#, N-80 or equivalent 
marker collars or short casing joints to be placed at top of Price River and 400’ above top of Wasatch.   
Centralizers to be placed 5’ above shoe on joint #1, top of joint #2, and every 3rd joint to 400’ above the 
top of primary object. Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of float collar, and top of 2

nd
 joint.   

 

6.   MUD PROGRAM 
 

 Surface Hole Procedure (Surface - 2300’±): 

  
Air/air mist or aerated water. 

 

Production Hole Procedure (2300’± - TD):   

 
Anticipated mud weight 9.5 – 10.5 ppg depending on actual wellbore conditions encountered while 
drilling. 

 
2300’± - TD A closed mud system will be utilized. A bentonite gelled water mud system will be used to control 

viscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay encapsulation/inhibition.  
Water loss will be maintained at <15cc’s using white starch or PAC.  Bactericides will be used as 
needed.  Anticipated pH will range from 9.0-10.0.  Mud weight will be adjusted as necessary for 
well control.  Deflocculants/thinners will be used as necessary to maintain mud quality.  LCM 
sweeps will be utilized as necessary to control lost circulation and mud loss.  CO2 contamination, 
if encountered, will be treated with lime and gypsum. 

 

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:   

 
Reference: Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 – Item E: Special Drilling Operations 

 
EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100’ 
in length. Due to reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be approximately 75’ in length 

 

 

 

’APIWellNo:43047507660000’'APIWellNo:43047507660000'

EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1400-32X
SEISW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M..

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

5. Float Equipment:

Surface Hole Procedure (0'-2300'±)

Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Centralizers: 1-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5th

jOint to surface. (15 total)

Production Hole Procedure (2300'± - TD):

Float shoe, 1 joint casing, float collar and balance of casing to surface. 4-½", 11.6#, N-80 or equivalent
marker collars or short casing joints to be placed at top of Price River and 400' above top of Wasatch.
Centralizers to be placed 5' above shoe on joint #1, top of joint #2, and every 3rd joint to 400' above the
top of primary object. Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of float collar, and top of 2nd

jOint.

6. MUD PROGRAM

Surface Hole Procedure (Surface - 2300'±):

Airlair mist or aerated water.

Production Hole Procedure (2300'± - TD):

Anticipated mud weight 9.5 - 10.5 ppg depending on actual wellbore conditions encountered while
drilling.

2300'± - TD A closed mud system will be utilized. A bentonite gelled water mud system will be used to control
viscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay encapsulationlinhibition.
Water loss will be maintained at <15cc's using white starch or PAC. Bactericides will be used as
needed. Anticipated pH will range from 9.0-10.0. Mud weight will be adjusted as necessary for
well control. Deflocculants/thinners will be used as necessary to maintain mud quality. LCM
sweeps will be utilized as necessary to control lost circulation and mud loss. CO2 contamination,
if encountered, will be treated with lime and gypsum.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:

Reference: Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 - Item E: Special Drilling Operations

EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100'
in length. Due to reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be approximately 75' in length

8 point plan-EOG 2



EIGHT POINT PLAN 

 

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1400-32X 

SE/SW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.. 

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH 

8 point plan-EOG 3 9/11/2009  

 

 

 

 

 

8.  EVALUATION PROGRAM: 

 
Logs:     Mud log from base of surface casing to TD.   
Cased-hole Logs: Cased-hole logs will be run in lieu of open-hole logs consisting of the following: 

CBL/CCL/VDL/GR  

 

9.  CEMENT PROGRAM: 

   
 Surface Hole Procedure (Surface - 2300’±): 

 
Lead:   185 sks  Class “G” cement with 16% Gel, 10 #/sx Gilsonite, 3% Salt, 2% CaCI2, 

3 lb/sx GR3 ¼ #/sx Flocele mixed at 11 ppg, 3.82 ft
3
/sk. yield, 23 gps water.   

 
Tail:     207 sks  Class "G” cement with 2% CaCI2, ¼#/sk Flocele mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 ft

3
/sk., 

5.2 gps water.    

 

Top Out:     As necessary with Class “G” cement with 2% CaCI2, ¼#/sk Flocele mixed at 15.6  

ppg, 1.18 ft
3
/sk., 5.2 gps water. 

 
Note:   Cement volumes will be calculated to bring lead cement to surface and tail 

cement to 500’above the casing shoe. 

 
Production Hole Procedure (2300’± - TD) 

 
Lead:    113 sks:  Hi-Lift “G” w/12% D20 (Bentonite), 1% D79 (Extender), 5% D44 

(Salt),0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.25% D112 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.25 pps D29 
(cello flakes) mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.91 ft

3
/sk., 24.5 gps water.   

 

 
Tail:   875 sks:  50:50 Poz “G” w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.075%  

D13 (Retarder), 0.2% D167 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),  
mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 ft

3
/sk., 5.9gps water.  

 
Note:   The above number of sacks is based on gauge-hole calculation. 

Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to 200’± above 9-5/8” casing shoe.   
Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement to 400’± above top of Wasatch. 
 

Final Cement volumes will be based upon gauge-hole plus 45% excess. 

 

 

 

’APIWellNo:43047507660000’'APIWellNo:43047507660000'

EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1400-32X
SEISW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M..

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:

Logs: Mud log from base of surface casing to TD.
Cased-hole Logs: Cased-hole logs will be run in lieu of open-hole logs consisting of the following:

CBL/CCLIVDLIGR

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (Surface - 2300'±):

Lead: 185 sks Class "G" cement with 16% Gel, 10 #lsx Gilsonite, 3% Salt, 2% CaCl2,
3 lb/sx GR3 ¼ #lsx Flocele mixed at 11 ppg, 3.82 ñ3/Sk. yield, 23 gps water.

Tail: 207 sks Class "G" cement with 2% CaCl2, ¼#|Sk Flocele mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 ñ3/Sk.,

5.2 gps water.

Top Out: As necessary with Class "G" cement with 2% CaCl2, ¼#/Sk Flocele mixed at 15.6
ppg, 1.18 ñ3/Sk., 5.2 gps water.

Note: Cement volumes will be calculated to bring lead cement to surface and tail
cement to 500'above the casing shoe.

Production Hole Procedure (2300'± - TD)

Lead: 113 sks: Hi-Lift"G" w/12% D20 (Bentonite), 1% D79 (Extender), 5% D44
(Salt),0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.25% D112 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.25 pps D29
(cello flakes) mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.91 ñ3/Sk., 24.5 gps water.

Tail: 875 sks: 50:50 Poz "G" w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.075%
D13 (Retarder), 0.2% D167 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),
mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 ft3/Sk., 5.9gps water.

Note: The above number of sacks is based on gauge-hole calculation.
Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to 200'± above 9-5/8" casing shoe.
Tail volume to be calculated to bring cement to 400'± above top of Wasatch.

Final Cement volumes will be based upon qauqe-hole plus 45% excess.

8 point plan-EOG 3



EIGHT POINT PLAN 

 

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1400-32X 

SE/SW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.. 

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH 

8 point plan-EOG 4 9/11/2009  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

10.  ABNORMAL CONDITIONS: 
  

Surface Hole (Surface - 2300’±): 

  
Lost circulation  

 
Production Hole (2300’± - TD): 

 

Sloughing shales, lost circulation and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch 
Formation.  

 

 

11.  STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT: 

 

A.  Choke Manifold 

B.  Upper and Lower Kelly Cock 

C.  Stabbing Valve 

D.  Visual Mud Monitoring 

 

12.  HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS: 

 
No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds will be 
used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.  Furthermore, 
no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, 
produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well. 

 

(Attachment:  BOP Schematic Diagram) 

’APIWellNo:43047507660000’'APIWellNo:43047507660000'

EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1400-32X
SEISW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M..

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

Surface Hole (Surface - 2300'±):

Lost circulation

Production Hole (2300'± - TD):

Sloughing shales, lost circulation and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch
Formation.

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Upper and Lower Kelly Cock
C. stabbingValve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds will be
used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore,
no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used,
produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG 4



11" 5k
R-54

11" 5k
R-54

11" 5k
R-54

13-3/8"

9-5/8"

PIPE RAMS

BLIND RAMS

ANNULAR
PREVENTER

ROTATING
HEAD

FMC “DTO” 9-5/8"
SOW X 5,000 W.P.

FMC DRILLING
CONNECTOR, 11"
5,000 X DTO PREP

EOG RESOURCES  11" 5,000 PSI W.P. BOP
CONFIGURATION PAGE 1 OF 2

4-1/16" 5,000
HCR VALVE

4-1/16" 5,000
MANUAL VALVE 2-1/16" 5,000

MANUAL VALVES
2-1/16" 5,000

CHECK VALVE

4" 5,000 PSI
CHOKE LINE
TO MANIFOLD

 

’APIWellNo:43047507660000’'APIWellNo:43047507660000'

IEOG RESOURCES 11" 5,000 PSI W.P. BOP
CONFIGURATION PAGE 1 OF 2

11" 5
R-54

IND
I

4-1/16" 5,000 4-1/16" 5,000
HCRVALVE MANUALVALVE 11" 5 2-1/16"5000 2-1/16"5000

11" 5
FMC DRILLING

CONNECTOR 11
5,000X DTO PREP

sFM D
0

0-5 "
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 Testing Procedure: 
1. BOP will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2. 
2. Blind and Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5,000 psi. 
3. Annular Preventer will be tested to 50% working pressure, 2,500 psi. 

Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi / ft. or 1,500 psi. Not to exceed 70% of burst strength, 
whichever is greater. 

4. All lines subject to well pressure will be tested to the same pressure as blind and pipe rams. 
5. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2 requirements. 

 

’APIWellNo:43047507660000’'APIWellNo:43047507660000'

EOG RESOURCES CHOKE MANIFOLD CONFIGURATION PAGE20F2
W/ 5,000 PSI WP VALVES

3" MIN. ID TO 3" MIN. ID BLEED 3" MIN. ID TO
SEPARATOR, OR PIT LINE TO PIT SEPARATOR, OR PIT

MANUAL
CHOKE

ADJUSTABLE

4" 5,000 PSI CHOKE
LINE FROM HCR

VALVE

Testing Procedure:
1. BOP will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2.
2. Blind and Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5,000 psi.
3. Annular Preventer will be tested to 50% working pressure, 2,500 psi.

Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi / ft. or 1,500 psi. Not to exceed 70% of burst strength,
whichever is greater.

4. All lines subject to well pressure will be tested to the same pressure as blind and pipe rams.
5. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2
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eogresources

Chapita Wells Unit 1400·32X
SESW Section 32, TOS,R23E

Uintah Coung, Utah

SURFACEUSE PLAN

1. BosnNe RaAos:

A. See attachedPlate showingdirectional referencestakeson location, andattached
TOPOMap"B"showingaccessto location fromexistingroads.

B. The poposed wellshe is locatedapproximately55.4 milessouthofVernal, Utah-

See attachedTOPOMap"A".

C. Refer toattachedTopographic Map"A"showing labeled accessmutetolocation.

D. Existingroads willbe maintainedand repairedas necessary.

2. PLANNEDACCESS ROAD:

A. An existingaccess roadwillbe usedto accessthelocation. See attachedTopo B.

B. The accessroadha6 a 40-foot ROW w/18footrunningsurface.

C. No turnoutswillbe required.

D. The accessroad willbe dlrtsurface.

E. Nogates, cattleguards,or fenCG6 willbe requiredorencountered.

F. A40-footpermanentright-of-way16requested. Nosurfacingmaterialwillused.

G. Noadditionalstorageareas willbe neededfor storingequipment,stockpiling,or
vehicleparking.

Alltravelwillbe confinedtoexl6ting800088 FOad rights-of-way.

Newor recon6tructedroads willbe centerlined-flagged attimeof location staking.
The roadshallbe constructedlupgradedto meetthestandardsofthe anticipatedtrafficflow
andall-weatherroad requirements.Construction/upgradingshallInclude ditching, draining,
graveling,crowning,andcappingtheroadbed as necessarytoprovidea wellconstructed
saferoad. Prior toupgrading,the road shallbe clearedofanysnowcoverandallowedtodry
completely.Travelingoffthe40 foot right-of-waywillnotbe allowed.Road drainage
crossingsshallbe ofthetypicaldry creekdrainage crossingtype.Crossingsshallbe
designedso theywillnotcausesiltationoraccumulationofdebris In thedralnage
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norshallthedrainages be blockedbytheroadbed. Erosionofdralnage ditches by runoff
watershai be preventedbydivertingwateroffat frequent intervalsbymeansofcutouls.
Upgradingshallnotbe allowedduringmuddyconditions.Shouldmudholes develop, they
shallbe filledInanddetours aroundthenavoided.

As operator,EOGResources, Inc.shallbe responsiblefor allmaintenanceoncattleguards,
orgates associatedwiththisoliand/orgas operation.

Travelingoffthe40 foot right-of-waywillnotbe allowed.The accessroad andassociated
drainagestructureswillbe constructedandmaintainedin accordancewlthroadguldelines
containedInthejointBLM/USFSpublication:SurfaceOperatingStandards for 011andGas
ExplorationandDevelopment,ThirdEdition,and/orBLMManualSection9113 concerning
roadconstructionstandardsonprojects subjectto federal jurisdiction.Duringthedrillingand
productionphase ofoperations,theroad surfaceandshoulderswillbe kept Ina safeand
useableconditionanddralnageditches andculvertswllibe kept clearandfree flowing.

3. LocAnoN oF ExisnNe inu.s iMonsA ONE·¾.E RADIUS:

See attachedTOPOmap C"for thelocation of wellswithina one-mileradius.

4. LocAnow oF EXiBUNGANNOR PROPOSED PRODUCWONFACILlWES:

A, On RN And

1. Production facilitieswillbe set on location ifthewellIs successfullycompletedfor
production. FacilitieswillconsistofweNheadvalves,comboseparatordehyunit
withmeter,two(2) 400-bbl verticaltanksandattachingpiping.

2. Gas gatheringIlnes- A 4" gatheringIInewillbe buried fromdehyto theedgeof
the location.

B. Off HPad

1. Proposed p¢ellne willtransportnaturalgas.

2. The pipellnewillbe a permanentfeeder Ilne.

3. The length oftheproposedp¢ellne is 522' x 40'. The proposedpipelineleaves
theeasternedgeoftheproposed locationproceedingina easterlydirectionfor
anapproximatedistance of522' tielngIntoan existingpipellnein theSESW of
Section32, TOS,R23E. PIpe willbe 4" NOM,0.156wall,GradeX42, Zap-Lock,
electricweldwitha 35 milX-Trucoating.

4. Proposed pipellne WHIbe a 4"ODsteel,zap-loklinelaid onthesurface

5. Proposed pipelinewillbe laidonsurface.

6. Pipeline WIIIbe coupledusingtheZap lock method.No additionaloff-padfacilltles
WIIIbe
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Alfpermanent(onsitefor sixmonthsor longer) structuresconstructedor installed (including
pumpingunits)willbe painteda flat, non-reflective,earthtonecolorto matchoneofthe
standardenvironmentalcolors,as determinedbytheRockyMountainFiveState Interagency
Committee.AIIfacilitieswillbe palntedwithin6 monthsofInstallatlon.AIIfacilities wlllbe
painted withCariabad Canyon. FacilitiesrequiredtocomplywithO.S.H.A.(Occupational
Safety andHealthAct)willbe excluded.

6. LocArto# ANDTYPE oF \¥ATER SUPPLY:

A. Watersupplywillbe fromOurayBonanza Power Plant watersourceinSec 26,
TBS,R23E UIntahCounty,UT(State WaterRight#49-225(A31368)).WaterWIII
be hauled by a licensedtruckingcompany.

B. Waterwillbe hauledby a icensed truckingcompany.

C. Nowaterwellwilbe drlliedon fease.

8. SouRex oF Consinucrion MAran; ALs:

A. Allconstructlonmaterialfor thispipellnewillbe ofnativeborrowand solf
accumulatedduringtheconstructionofthe location.

B. No mineralmaterialswillbe required.

1. METHODSOF RANDUNG IAYASTEASPOSAL:

A. METHODSANDLOCA710N

1. Cuttingswllfbe confinedIn thereserve pit.

2. A portabletolletwiffbe providedforhuman wasteduringthedrillingand
completlonofthewell.Disposalwllibe at theVernalsewagedisposal plant.

3. Burningwillnotbe allowed.Trash and otherwastematerialwillbe containedin a
wIremeshcage and disposedofat the UintahCountyLandfill.

4. Producedwastewaterwillbe confinedtoa finedpitorstoragetankfor a period
nottoexceed90 days afterInitialproductlon.Afterthe90 day period,the
producedwaterwillbe contalnedina tankon location andthendisposed ofat
oneofthefollowinglocations: Natural ButtesUnit21-208 SWD,AceDisposef,
CWU550-30N SWD,CWU2-29 SWD,Red Wash EvaporationPonds, 1, 2, 3, 4,
5, and/or6, CoyotePonde 1, 2, 3, and/or4, orEOGResources, Inc. drilling
operations(ChapitaWells Unit,Natural ButtesUnit&Stagecoach Unit).

5. Allchemicalswillbe disposed ofat an authorizeddisposalsite.Drlppans and
absorbentpade willbe usedonthedrillingrigtoavoidleakageofoiltothe
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B.Waterfromdrillingfluids andrecoveredduringtestingoperationswillbe disposedof
by eitherevaporatingInthe reserve pitorbyremovedanddisposed ofat an
authorlzeddisposalsite.Introductionofwellbore hydrocarbonstothe reserve pitwill
be avoidedby flaringthemoffinthe flare pit at thetimeofrecovery.

The reserve pit willbe constructedso as notto leak,break,orallowdischarge.Ifthe
reserve pitrequkespadding priorto lining(due torockyconditions)felt paddingwillbe
used.

The reservepitshallbe linedwithfelt anda 16 millimeterplasticilner. Sufflolent
bedding(I.e. weedfree straw,orhay; felt; polyswellorsoll)tocoveranyrocks.The
IInerwilloverlapthe pitwallsandbe coveredwithditt and/orrockstoholdit inplace.
No trash,scrappipe,etc.,thatcouldpuncturetheIlnerwillbe disposed ofInthepit.
Morestringentprotectiverequirementsmaybe deemed necessary bythe A.O.

EOGResources, Inc. maintainsa flie, per 29 CFR 1910.1200 (g)contalningcurrent
MaterialSafetyData Sheets (MSDS)for allchemicals,compounds,and/orsubstances
whichareusedduring thecourseofconstruction,drilling,completion,andproduction
operationsfor thisproject. Hazardous materiale(substances)whichmaybe found at
thesliemayincludedrillingmudandcementingproductswhichareprlmarilyInhalation
hazards, fuels (flammable and/orcombustible),materialsthatmaybe necessary for
wellcompletion/stimulationactivitiessuchas flammable orcombustiblesubstances
andacidelgets(corrosims).The opportunityfor SuperfundAmendments and
ReauthorizationAct (SARA)IIstedExtremelyHazardousSubstanoes (EHS)at thealte
is generallyIlmitedto proprietarytreatingchemicals.AllhazardousandEHSand
commercialpreparationswillbe handled Inan appropriatemannerto minimizethe
potentialfor leaksorspillstotheenvironment.

Nochemicalssubjectto reportingunderSARATItleIII(hazardous materlais)Inan
amountgreater than10,000 pounds willbe used,produced,stored,transported,or
disposed ofannuallyInassociationwiththedrlling,testing,orcompletlonofthe well.
Furthermore,extremelyhazardoussubstances,as definedIn40 CFR 355, in threshold
planningquantitles,willnotbe used,produced,stored,transported,ordisposed ofin
associatlonwlththedrilling,testingorcompletionofthewell.

8. ANCILI.ARYFACILITIES:

Noneanticipated.

9. War.L SITE LAYOUT:

A. Refer toattachedwellsiteplat for related topographycutsandfillsandcross
sections.

B, Refer to attachedwellsiteplat for rig layout andsollmaterialstockpilelocation as
approvedonOn-site.

C. Referto attachedwellsiteplatfor rigorientation,parkingareas,andaccess
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The reserve pitwillbe located onthesouthcornerofthe location. The flare pitwllibe located
downwindoftheprevallingwinddirectiononthesouthsideofthelocation, a minimumof100
feet from thewellhead and30 feet from thereserve pitfence.

Thestockpliedpit topsoll(firstsixInches)willbe storedseparatefrom the location topsoll.
The stockpiledlocation topsollwillbe storedin a location providingeasyaccessforInterim
reclamationandprotectionofthetopsoll.Uponcompletionofconstruction,thestockpiled
topsollfrom thelocation willbe broadcastseededwiththeapprovedseed mixturefrom this
locationandthenwalkeddownwitha Caterpillertractor.

Access tothewellpad willbe fromthewest.

FENCINGREQUIREMENTS:

Allpits wllibe fenced accordingtothefollowingminimumstandards:

A. Thirty-nineInch netWIreshallbe usedwithat least onestrandofbarbedwireontop
ofthe netwire.(BarbedwIreis notnecessary Ifpipe orsometypeofreinforcement
rod le attachedto thetopoftheentirefence.)

8. The net wIreshallbe nomorethan2 inches abovetheground. The barbedwire
strandshallbe 3 Inches abovethenetwire.TotalhelghtofthefenCO 6hall be at least
42 Inches.

C, Cornerpoets shallbe cementedand/orbraced in sucha manneras tokeep the
fence tightatalltimes.

D. Standardsteel,wood,orpipeposts shallbe usedbetweenthecornerbraces.
Maximumdistances betweenanytwoposts shallbe nogreater than16 feet.

E. AllwIreshallbe stretchedbyusinga stretchingdevloebefore it16attachedtothe
cornerpoets.

The reserve pitfencingwllibe onthethreesidesduringdrillingoperationsandonthe
fourthsidewhenthe rigmovesofflocation.PItswllibe fenced antimaintaineduntil
clean-up.

Eachexistingfence tobe crossedbytheaccess roadshallbe braced andtiedoffbefore
cuttingso as topreventslackingofthewIre.The openingshallbe closedtemporarilyas
necessaryduringconstructiontoprevent theescapeof Ilvestock,and,uponcompletion
ofconstruction,the fence_shallba_tenaltedlo_Stkor_SMianecificanaps.Acattleguard
withan adjacent16 foot gate shallbe Installed in anyfence wherea road is regularly

b traveled.Ifthewellis a producer,thecattleguards( all/shalLnot)be permanently
8 countedonconcretebases. Prior tocrossinganyfence locatedon Federal land,orany

fence between Federal land andprivateland, theoperatorwillcontacttheBLM,whowill
Inturncontactthegrazingpermitteeorownerofsaidfence andofferhlmater the
opportun\tytobe present whenthe fence is cutinordertosatisfyhimselflherself thatthe
fence Is adequatelybraced andtied
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10.PLANS FORRECLAMATIONOF THESumFAcs:

A, InterimRoolamedion (Producing Locadon)

Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,thelocationandsurroundingarea willbe cleared
ofallunusedtubing,equipment,debris, materials,trash,andjunknot requiredfor
production.

Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,anyhydrocarbonsonthepit shallbe removedin
accordanoewlthCFR 3162.7-1.

Ifa plastlonylonreinforcedIIneris used, itshallbe tornandperforatedbefore
backfillingofthe reserve pit.

The reservepitandthatportionofthe location not needed forproduction
foolllties/operatlonewillbe recontouredtothe approximatenaturalcontours-- See
attachedFigure#3. The reservepitwillbe reclaimedwithin90days from thedate of
thewellcompletion,oras soonas environmentalconditionsallow,Before anydirt .

takesplace, thereserve pitmustbe oompletelydryandfree ofallforeign obstacles.
Thestockpliedpittopsollwl11thenbe spreadoverthepit areaandbroadcast seeded
withtheprescribedseed mixturefor thislocation.Theseededareawillthenbe
walkeddownwitha cat.

B. DryHola/Abendoned Locadon

Atsuchtimeas thewellIsplugged and abandoned,theoperatorwillsubmita
sub6equentreportofabandonmentandthe BLMwillattachtheappropriatedsurface
rehabilitationconditionsofapproval.

11.SunFAce OleNansule:

Surfaceownershipoftheproposedwellsite,accessroad,andpipellneroute Is as follows:

State of Utah

12.O'INER ÖNPORMATION:

A. EOGResourCO6, IDC.WillInf0fmallPGFSODSIn theaf68Wh0 areassociatedwiththis
projectthattheyaresubjecttoprosecutionfor knowinglydisturbin9historicor
archaeologicalsites,orfor collectingartifacts,If historicor archaeologicalmaterials
areuncoveredduringconstruction,theoperatorwll!Immediatelystopworkthatmight
furtherdisturbsuchmaterials,andcontacttheAuthorizedOffloer.Withinfive working
days theAuthorizedOfficerwillInformtheoperatoras to:

• Whether the materialsappearellglblefortheNationalRegister of Historic
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• The mitigationmeasurestheoperatorwilllikelyhave to undertakebeforethe
sitecanbe used.

• A timeframefortheAuthorizedOfficertocompleteenexpeditedreviewunder
36 CFR800.11toconfirm,throughtheState Historic Preservation Officer,
thatthefindingsoftheAuthorizedOfficerarecorrectandthatmitigationis
appropriate.

Ifthe operatorwished,at anytime,to reloosteactivitiestoavoidtheexpenseof
mitigationand/orthedelaysassoolatedwiththisprocess, theAuthorizedOfficerwill
assumeresponelbilityforwhateverrecordationandstablifzationoftheexposed
materialsthatmaybe required.Otherwise,theoperatorwlllbe responsiblefor
mitigationcosts.The AuthorizedOffloerwlliprovldetechnicalandprocedural
guldellnesfor theconductofmitigation.Uponverlilcationfromthe AuthorizedOfficer
thatrequiredmitigationhas been completed,theoperatorwillthenbe allowedto
resume construction.

B. Asoperator,EOGResources, Inc.willcontrolnoxiousweedsalongRight-of-Waysfor
roads,pipelines,wellsites,orotherappilcablefacilities.A IIstofnoxiousweedswill
be obtainedfromthe BLMadministeredland,a Pesticide Use proposalshallbe
submitted,andgivenapproval,priorto theapplicationor herbicides orother
pesticidesorpossiblehazardouschemicals.

C. DrillingrigeandAarequ¢mentusedduringdrillingoperationeonthiswellsitewillnot
be stackedorstoredonBLMlands aftertheconclusionofdrillingoperationsoratany
othertimewithoutBLMauthorlzation.However, ifBLMauthorizationis obtained,ItIs
onlya temporarymeasureto allowtimeto make arrangementsfor permanentstorage
oncommercialfaclinies. (TheBLMdoes notseektocompetewithprivateIndustry.
There are commercialfacilitiesavailableforstackingandstoringdrillingrige.)

D. The drillingrigandancillaryequipmentwillbe removedfrom the location priorto
commencementofcompletionoperations.Completionoperationswillbe conducted
utilizinga completion/workoverrig.

Al lease and/orunitoperationswillbe conductedinsucha mannerthatfullcompilanceIs
madewithallapplicablelaws, regulations,OnshoreOliandGas Orders,theapprovedPlan
ofOperations,andanyappilcableNoticeofLessees. The operatoris fullyresponsiblefor
theactionsofits subcontractors.Acompletecopyoftheapproved"ApplicationforPermitto
DrliN WIIIbe furnished tothefleidrepresentative(s)toensurecomplianceandshallbe on
locationduringallconstructionanddrillingoperations.

Constructionactivitywllinot be conductedusingfrozen orsaturatedsolismaterialorduring
periodswhenwatersheddamage is likelytooccur.

Iftheexistingaccessroad,proposedaccessroad, andproposedpad aredryduring
construction,drilling,andcompletionactivities,waterwillbe applied,as needed,tohelp
facIltatecompactionduringconstructionandto minimizesollloss as a resultofwind
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Aculturalresources surveyandpaleontologysurveywlllbe conductedandsubmlttedby
MontgomeryArchaeological
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LESSEE OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVEANDCERTIFICATION:

PERMITTINGAGENT
Kaylene R. Gardner
EOGResources, Inc.
P.O. Box 1815
Vernal,Ut 84078
(435) 781-9111

Alliease and/orunitoperationswillbe conductedin sucha mannerthatfullcomplianceis
made withallapplicablelaws,regulations,OnshoreOliandGas Orders,the approvedplan
ofoperations,andanyapplicableNoticetoLessees. The operatoris fullyresponsiblefor the
actionsofhis subcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe furnished tothefield
representativeto insure compliance.

CERTIFICATION:

I hereby certifythatI,orpersons undermydlrectsupervision,have inspected theproposed
drillalteandaccessroute;thatIamfamillarwlththeconditionswhichcurrentlyexist;thatthe
statementsmadein thlsplan are,tothebest ofmyknowledge, trueandcorrect;andthatthe
workassociatedwiththeoperationsproposed herein willbe performedbyEOGResources,
Inc. andItscontractorsandsubcontractorsin conformitywiththisplan andthetermsand
condItlons underwhichit is approved.Thls statementIs subjecttothe provisions of18
U.S.C.1001 for thefilingofa false statement.

Please be advlsedthatEOGResources, Inc. Is con6ideredto be theoperatoroftheChapita
WellsUnit 1400-SgWell,locatedin theSESW, ofSection32, T9S, R23E,UlntahCounty,
Utah;State land andmlnerals;andis responsble underthetermsandconditionsofthe
lease for theoperationsconducteduponthe lease nds.Bond Coverageis underBond #
NM2308.

Ddte R. ardner,Lead Regulatory
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.
CWU #1400-32X

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHWESTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW OF EXISTINGACCESS CAMERAANGLE: SOUTHEASTERLY

a LOCATIONPHOTos 5 2 09 PHOTO
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 ONTH DAY YEAR

- Since 1964 - (435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-18 13 TAKENBY:C.R. DRAWNBY:Z.L. REVISED:
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T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M EOG RESOURCES, INC.
Well location, CWU #1400-32X, located as shown

SB956'JJ"W - 26]EJJ' (Meas.) SB956'27"W - 2640.72' (Meos.) in the SE 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section 32, T9S, R23E,
A L A k S.L.B.&M., Uintah County, Utah.

Brass Cop 1977 Bross Cop, 1977 Bross Cop
0.4' High, Steel in Center of 20'
soa, Frie or stones, sige me or stones BASIS OF ELEVATION
Steel Post 10' SL Y

BENCHMARK 58 EAM (1965) LOCATED IN THE NE 1/4 OF
SECTION 30, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE RED
WASH SE, QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY 7.5 MINUTE
QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 5132 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
LINE TABLE BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

LINE DIRECTION LENGTH
L1 NOO°30'28"W 1104.89'

1977H
h, P 1977 Brass Cop

of Stones 0.4' High, P//e

32 of Stones

o o o
o o o- L -

CWU /1400- J2X
E/ev. Graded Unground = 5281 SC A LE

2631' I CERTIFICATE
LAND

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE D
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS M OR UNDER
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME A U O
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIE

1977 Bross Cop 1977 Bross Cop 1977 Bross Cop 1.J'

08' High, Pile of 0.2' High, Pile of High, Red Steel Post,
REGIST DL DS ORT9S

A
LStones, Steel Post Stones, Stee/ Post Pile of Stones

REGISTR

T10S ss259'46"w - 2647-28' 58956'03"w - 263537' ÚUS * REVISED: 08-18-09 STATE o E Œ

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINGBASIS OF BEARINGS
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.
CD 435 789-1017

LEGEND: (NAD 83)
SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

LATITUDE=
39°59'17.79" (39.988275) 1" = 1000' 04-28-08 05-28-08

=
90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE=

109°21'02.66" (109.350739)
PARTY REFERENCES

(NAD 27) C.R C.M C.H G.L.O. PLATO = PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE=
39°59'17.91" (39.988308)

A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE=
109°21'00.22" (109.350061)

WEATHER

WARM
FILEEOG

RESOURCES,
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EOG RESOURCES, INC. |FIGURE #iApprox.
'o, LOCATION LAYOUT FOR Toe of
a CWU #1400-32X Fiii siope

, SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.E-5.6 E-12.6
E 74.5 1105' FSL 2631' FWL a se y

8

111' Sta. J+75
F-8.9' ** *

SCALE: 1 = 50 E 722' AND
DATE: 05-28-08 Round Corners

Drawn By: C.H. as needed ce
REV: 08-18- 9 - No 1613 9
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RIG DOG HOUSE
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36 |
c

| 150' Sta. 1+75

I I -
PUMP

TOILET

MUD SHED

HOPPER

POWER

TOOLS

FUEL Sto. 0+50

li ii

STORAG
TRASH s TANK

3 E/. By J'
Sta. 0+00 2

20' WIDE BENCH

I I E/. 85 5' E/ 79.5'

E/ev. Ungraded Ground at /1400- J2 Location Stoke = 5287.0'
s UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

E/ev. Groded Ground at /1400-32 Locot/on Stoke = 5281.1 85 So. 200 East * Verrtal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789-1017
I
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EOG RESOURCES, INC. FIGURE #2
×-section TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR

scale CWU #1400-32X
LAND

SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. 8

DATE: 05-28-08 1105' FSL 2631' FWL No. 161319
Drawn By: C.H.

REV: 08-18-09 111' Oished

Grade

S TA. J+ 75 -
126 150

LOCA T/ON STAKE

I
I I I
I l I- ¯fTT¯fTT¯¯ETT¯¯E'¯\\\=Ill III III=Ill=Ill III III III¯¯III¯¯I I¯¯III¯¯III¯¯II'

S TA. 1+ 75

15 75' 36' 150' 's

Pre cons truc tion
Grade S/ope= 1 1/2: 1

Typ.)

cuT
-¯ STA. 0+50

26' 150

sra. o oo
APPROX/MA TE ACREAGES
WELL S/TE D/STURBANCE = ± 2 749 ACRES

P/PEL/NE D/STURBANCE = ± 0.360 ACRES
NOTE: * NOTE:

ITopsoil should not be ETÆ - ± l1Œ ACRES E/LL QUANT/TY/NCLUDES
Stripped Below Finished 5% TOR COMPA CT/ON
Grade on Substructure Area.

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = 4,340 Cu. Yds.

Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 4,340 Cu. Yds.

(6") Topsoil Stripping = 2,320 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol )
Remaining Location = 16,860 Cu. Yds. EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.

(After Interirn Rehabilitation)
TOTAL CUT = 19,180 CU. YDS.
FILL = 14,840 CU. YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435)
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EOG RESOURCES, INC· FIGURE #3
PRODUCTION FACILITY LAYOUT FOR

CWU #1400-32X liiffit
SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. LAND Êÿ

1105' FSL 2631' FWL e #' No. 161 19 a
Om

SCALE: 1" = 50' r Y ·
c

DATE: 05-28-08

Drawn By: C.H.
REV: 08-18-09 E OF

COMBO UN

I BERM

RE-HABED AREA UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 East * Verrtal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789-1017

I



EOG RESOURCES, INC. 
CWU #1400-32X 

SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. 
 
 

PROCEED IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL, UTAH ALONG U.S. 
HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 14.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATE 
HIGHWAY 88;  EXIT LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION 
APPROXIMATELY 17.0 MILES TO OURAY, UTAH; PROCEED IN A 
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3 MILES ON THE SEEP RIDGE 
ROAD TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE 
EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION 
APPROXIMATELY 12.3 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN 
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A 
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.7 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF 
THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND 
PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.9 MILES TO THE 
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST; 
TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION 
APPROXIMATELY 0.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN 
EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN 
EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION 
APPROXIMATELY 4.5 MILES  TO  THE  JUNCTION OF  THIS  ROAD  AND  AN  
EXISTING  ROAD  TO  THE  SOUTHEAST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A 
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.1 MILES TO THE 
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN 
RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.2 
MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE 
SOUTHWEST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHWESTERLY 
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.6 MILES TO THE  JUNCTION OF  THIS  ROAD 
 AND  AN  EXISTING  ROAD  TO  THE  SOUTHWEST; TURN RIGHT AND 
PROCEED IN A SOUTHWESTERLY, THEN NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTION 
APPROXIMATELY 1.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN 
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A 
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3 MILES TO THE 
PROPOSED LOCATION.  
 
TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL 
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 55.4 MILES. 

’APIWellNo:43047507660000’'APIWellNo:43047507660000'

EOG RESOURCES, INC.
CWU #1400-32X

SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL, UTAH ALONG U.S.
HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 14.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATE
HIGHWAY 88; EXIT LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 17.0 MILES TO OURAY, UTAH; PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3 MILES ON THE SEEP RIDGE
ROAD TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 12.3 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.7 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF
THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND
PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.9 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST;
TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN
EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 4.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.1 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN
RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.2
MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
SOUTHWEST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHWESTERLY
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.6 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD
AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHWEST; TURN RIGHT AND

PROCEED IN A SOUTHWESTERLY, THEN NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 1.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3 MILES TO THE
PROPOSED LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 55.4
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.7 MI. +/-

C P FA W AS -IELD

1.9 MI. +/

io s

PROPOSED LOCATION:
CWU #1400-32X

LEGEND: EOGRESOURCES, INC.
O PROPOSED LOCATION N CWU #1400-32X

SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
1105' FSL 2631' FWL

A Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 5 2 O
85 Soutlx 200 East Vernal, Utalu 84078 .I À ONTH DAY YEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE:1:100,000 DRAWNBY:Z.L. REVISED:
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O L +/-

I

l ML +/-| o Gs el

LEGEND: EOGRESOURCES, INC.
EXISTING ROAD N CWU #1400-32X

----------- PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
1105' FSL 2631' FWL

A Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 5 2 O
85 Soutlx 200 East Vernal, Utalu 84078 i À ONTH DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1" = 2000' DRAWNBY:Z.L. REVISED:
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IT9S PROPOSED LOCATION:

LEGEND: EOGRESOURCES, INC.
DISPOSAL WELLS MATER WELLS N CWU #1400-32X
PRODUCING WELLS ABANDONED WELLs SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
SHUTIN WELLS - - TEMPORARILYABANDONED 1105' FSL 2631' FWL

A Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 5 2 O
85 South 200 East VernaL, IJtah 84078 i À ONTH DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1" = 2000' DRAWNBY:Z.L. REVISED:
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5

33
31

29

46

28
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4304710260
CWU 4

4304731030
CWU 56-29

4304730712
CWU 52-33

4304730711
CWU 51-32

4304730710
CWU 50-32

4304730703
CWU 53-33

4304750725
CWU 778-32

4304750331
CWU 737-33

4304750257
CWU 738-33

4304750025
CWU 952-32

4304740327
CWU 777-29

4304740326
CWU 726-28

4304739873
CWU 959-33

4304739798
CWU 962-33

4304739789
CWU 733-33

4304739725
CWU 734-33

4304739723
CWU 730-29

4304739684
CWU 735-33 4304739682

CWU 736-33

4304739639
CWU 725-28

4304739619
CWU 958-33

4304739599
CWU 732-32

4304739582
CWU 731-32

4304739515
CWU 956-32

4304739216
CWU 698-32

4304739199
CWU 699-32

4304739197
CWU 697-32

4304739056
CWU 719-33 4304738961

CWU 963-33

4304738862
CWU 722-32

4304738720
CWU 942-29

4304738719
CWU 945-29

4304737859
CWU 704-29

4304737858
CWU 943-29 4304737500

CWU 703-29

4304737499
CWU 681-28

4304737494
CWU 689-33

4304737458
CWU 685-29

4304737415
CWU 695-32

4304736972
CWU 961-33

4304736971
CWU 955-32

4304736959
CWU 687-30

4304736927
CWU 815-28

4304736760
CWU 951-30

4304736720
CWU 944-29

4304736487
CWU 953-32

4304736486
CWU 957-32

4304736485
CWU 660-30

4304736008
CWU 949-30

4304735579
CWU 862-32

4304735353
CWU 860-32

4304735280
CWU 872-30

4304735278
CWU 859-29

4304735277
CWU 874-29

4304735276
CWU 876-29

4304735275
CWU 875-29 4304735274

CWU 879-28
4304735272
CWU 858-30

4304735249
CWU 867-33

4304735226
CWU 864-33

4304735225
CWU 868-33

4304735224
CWU 866-33

4304735223
CWU 865-33

4304735222
CWU 861-32

4304735221
CWU 863-32

4304735205
CWU 852-324304735204

CWU 851-32

4304735203
CWU 853-32

4304735176
CWU 855-33

4304734078
CWU 805-32

4304750729
CWU 4049-324304750728

CWU 4048-32

4304750727
CWU 4047-32

4304750726
CWU 4046-32

4304750670
CWU 1462-29

4304750660
CWU 1460-29

4304750550
CWU 4016-32

4304750549
CWU 4015-32

4304750472
CWU 1463-28

4304750471
CWU 1461-28

4304750330
CWU 4004-30

4304750316
CWU 1097-28

4304750309
CWU 4021-28

4304750265
CWU 1423-29

4304750242
CWU 4005-30

4304750064
CWU 1400-32

4304750052
CWU 1399-32

4304750047
CWU 1391-33

4304750046
CWU 1381-33

4304750024
CWU 1030-32

4304750022
CWU 1377-32

4304750021
CWU 1390-324304750020

CWU 1376-32

4304750006
CWU 1296-30

4304740419
CWU 1401-33

4304740372
CWU 1371-30 4304740370

CWU 1389-29

4304740328
CWU 1380-33

4304740312
CWU 1403-33

4304740311
CWU 1402-33 4304740055

CWU 1379-33

4304739978
CWU 1392-33

4304739975
CWU 1372-29

4304739914
CWU 1375-29

4304739913
CWU 1378-28

4304739912
CWU 1072-28

4304739886
CWU 1370-30

4304739885
CWU 1373-29

4304739884
CWU 1374-29

4304739539
CWU 1294-30

4304739301
CWU 1328-32

4304739300
CWU 1331-32

4304739296
CWU 1325-32

4304739295
CWU 1327-32

4304739294
CWU 1326-32

4304739293
CWU 1330-32

4304737720
CWU 1031-32

4304737385
CWU 1119-28

4304736961
CWU 1069-33

4304736957
CWU 1068-28

4304740398
BONANZA 1023-6B 4304737328

BONANZA 1023-4B4304737325
BONANZA 1023-6B

4304737318
BONANZA 1023-5B

4304737315
BONANZA 1023-4D4304736176

BONANZA 1023-5C4304736067
BONANZA 1023-6A

4304735437
BONANZA 1023-4C

4304735366
BONANZA 1023-5A

4304740474
CWU 733-33X(RIGSKID)

4304737210
SOUTHMAN CYN 923-31A

4304737208
SOUTHMAN CYN 923-31G

4304737207
SOUTHMAN CYN 923-31I

4304737205
SOUTHMAN CYN 923-31O

4304735336
SOUTHMAN CYN 923-31H

4304735288
SOUTHMAN CYN 923-31P

4304735150
SOUTHMAN CYN 923-31B

4304735149
SOUTHMAN CYN 923-31J

4304735178
CWU 805-32X (RIGSKID)

4304730856
SOUTHMAN CANYON 1-5 (FED)

4304735809
BONANZA 1023-5AX (RIGSKID)

Map Produced by Diana Mason
Map Prepared: 

Well Name: CWU 1400-32X
API Number: 4304750766

Township 09.0 S Section 32Range 23.0 E
Meridian: SLBM

F
1,200 0 1,200600 Feet

1:12,113

Units
STATUS

ACTIVE

EXPLORATORY

GAS STORAGE

NF PP OIL

NF SECONDARY

PI OIL

PP GAS

PP GEOTHERML

PP OIL

SECONDARY

TERMINATED

Fields
STATUS

ACTIVE

COMBINED

Sections

Wells Query Events

D <all other values>

GIS_STAT_TYPE

" <Null>

APD

H DRL

4 GI 

!* GS 

N LA 
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7 OPS

ª PA 

* PGW

' POW
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¸ SGW

· SOW
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" TW 

¸ WD 

¸ WI 
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Millard
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San Juan
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Juab

Uintah
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Emery

Garfield

Grand

Utah

Beaver Wayne

Duchesne

Sevier

Summit

Rich

Washington

Carbon

Sanpete

Cache

Piute

Davis

Wasatch

Weber

Daggett
Salt Lake

Morgan

Location Map

Operator: EOG RESOURCES, INC.                               

’A
PIW

ellN
o:43047507660000’

4304739539 4304740372 4304740370 4304731030 4304739885 4304750660 4304750471 API Number: 4304750766CWU 1294-30 CWU 1371-30
CWU 1389 CWU 56-29 þCWU 1373-29 *CWU 1460-29 CWU 1461-28

4304750242 4304736008 4304738720 4304710260
C4WO4 228

Well Name: CWU 1400-32X
35

3 3 763

CWU 4005- CWU949-30 CWU942-29
43 47835592.

C
733907-

CO 3 43047730735 C4304 857 47325639 3047742063 TOwnship 09.0 S Range 23.0 E Section 32
4304750265 0473527 4304737385 Meridian: SLBM

4304739975
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CWU 1370-30 4304750006 4304750670 4 -U
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BOPE REVIEW           EOG Resources, Inc.   CWU 1400-32X  43047507660000

Well Name

String

Casing Size(")

Setting Depth (TVD)

Previous Shoe Setting Depth (TVD)

Max Mud Weight (ppg)

BOPE Proposed (psi)

Casing Internal Yield (psi)

Operators Max Anticipated Pressure (psi)

  Calculations Surf String 9.625 "

Max BHP (psi) .052*Setting Depth*MW=  

   BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

MASP (Gas) (psi) Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth)=  

MASP (Gas/Mud) (psi) Max BHP-(0.22*Setting Depth)=  

   *Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?

Pressure At Previous Shoe Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth)=  

Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure= psi

*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe= psi     *Assumes 1psi/ft frac gradient

  Calculations Prod String 4.500 "

Max BPH (psi) .052*Setting Depth*MW=  

   BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

MASP (Gas) (psi) Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth)=  

MASP (Gas/Mud) (psi) Max BHP-(0.22*Setting Depth)=  

   *Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?

Pressure At Previous Shoe Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth)=  

Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure= psi

*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe= psi     *Assumes 1psi/ft frac gradient

  Calculations String "

Max BHP (psi) .052*Setting Depth*MW=  

   BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

MASP (Gas) (psi) Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth)=  

MASP (Gas/Mud) (psi) Max BHP-(0.22*Setting Depth)=  

   *Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?

Pressure At Previous Shoe Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth)=  

Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure= psi

*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe= psi     *Assumes 1psi/ft frac gradient

  Calculations String "

Max BHP (psi) .052*Setting Depth*MW=  

   BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

MASP (Gas) (psi) Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth)=  

MASP (Gas/Mud) (psi) Max BHP-(0.22*Setting Depth)=  

   *Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?

Pressure At Previous Shoe Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth)=  

Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure= psi

*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe= psi     *Assumes 1psi/ft frac gradient

EOG Resources, Inc. CWU 1400-32X 43047507660000

Surf Prod

9.625 4.500

2300 9050

0 2300

8.3 10.5

500 5000

3520 7780

4712 10.0

996

720 NO OK

490 YES

490 NO Reasonable depth in area, no expected pressure

2300

0

4941

3855 YES

2950 YES OK

3456 NO Reasonable

5000

2300

NO

NO

NO

NO

NO

NO

BOPE REVIEW EOG Resources, Inc. CWU 1400-32X 43047507660000

Well Name EOG Resources, Inc. CWU 1400-32X 43047507660000

String Surt Prod

Casing Size(") 9.625 4.500

Setting Depth (TVD) 2300 9050

Previous Shoe Setting Depth (TVD) 0 2300

Max Mud Weight (ppg) 8.3 10.5

BOPE Proposed (psi) soo sooo

Casing Internal Yield (psi) 3520 7780

Operators Max Anticipated Pressure (psi) 4712 10.0

Calculations Surf String 9.625 "

Max BHP (psi) .052*Setting Depth*MW= 996

BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

MASP (Gas) (psi) Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth)= 720 NO OK

MASP (Gas/Mud) (psi) Max BHP-(0.22*Setting Depth)= 490 YES

*Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?

Pressure At Previous Shoe Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth)= 490 NO Reasonable depth in area, no expected pressure

Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure= 2300 psi

*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe= o psi *Assumes 1psi/ft frac gradient

Calculations Prod String 4.500 "

Max BPH (psi) .052*Setting Depth*MW= 4941

BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

MASP (Gas) (psi) Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth)= 3855 YES

MASP (Gas/Mud) (psi) Max BHP-(0.22*Sctting Depth)= 2950 YES OK

*Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?

Pressure At Previous Shoe Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth)= 3456 NO Reasonable

Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure= sooo psi

*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe= 2aoo psi *Assumes 1psi/ft frac gradient

Calculations String "

Max BHP (psi) .052*Setting Depth*MW=

BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

MASP (Gas) (psi) Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth)= NO

MASP (Gas/Mud) (psi) Max BHP-(0.22*Setting Depth)= NO

*Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?

Pressure At Previous Shoe Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth)= NO

Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure= psi

*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe= psi *Assumes lpsi/ft frac gradient

Calculations String "

Max BHP (psi) .052*Setting Depth*MW=

BOPE Adequate For Drilling And Setting Casing at Depth?

MASP (Gas) (psi) Max BHP-(0.12*Setting Depth)= NO

MASP (Gas/Mud) (psi) Max BHP-(0.22*Setting Depth)= NO

*Can Full Expected Pressure Be Held At Previous Shoe?

Pressure At Previous Shoe Max BHP-.22*(Setting Depth - Previous Shoe Depth)= NO

Required Casing/BOPE Test Pressure= psi

*Max Pressure Allowed @ Previous Casing Shoe= psi *Assumes lpsi/ft frac
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43047507660000 CWU 1400-32X
Casing Scheny tje

Surface

OC
652.

/ 5

9-5/8" Surface
MW 8.3 2300. MD
FraCc 19.

-3;uro 'k 6 RSCO

3854. . /

I
b/T/9 ' idev R' &A

I

4-1/2" Production '
MW 10.5 8830.
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Well name: 43047507660000 CWU 1400-32X
Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-047-50766
Location: UINTAH COUNTY

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.330 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 74 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 106 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 100 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 652 ft

Burst
Maxanticipated surface

pressure: 2,024 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 2,300 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.70 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 8,830 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 10.500 ppg
Neutral point: 2,017 ft Next setting BHP: 4,816 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 2,300 ft
Injection pressure: 2,300 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Est.
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Cost

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) ($)
1 2300 9.625 36.00 J-55 ST&C 2300 2300 8.796 19992

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (kips) (kips) Factor
1 995 2020 2.030 2300 3520 1.53 82.8 394 4.76 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801 538-5357 Date: September 24,2009
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 2300 ft, a mud weight of 8.33 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the
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Well name: 43047507660000 CWU 1400-32X
Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
String type: Production Project ID:

43-047-50766
Location: UINTAH COUNTY

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mudweight: 10.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 74 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 198 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 100 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 3,854 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 2,874 psi
Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 4,816 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.60 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 7,444 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Est.
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Cost

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) ($)
1 8830 4.5 11.60 N-80 LT&C 8830 8830 3.875 36365

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (kips) (kips) Factor
1 4816 6350 1.318 4816 7780 1.62 102.4 223 2.18 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801 538-5357 Date: September 24,2009
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Mining FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8830 ft, a mud weight of 10.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the



WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 9/11/2009 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43047507660000

WELL NAME: CWU 1400-32X   

OPERATOR: EOG Resources, Inc. (N9550) PHONE NUMBER: 435 781-9111

CONTACT: Kaylene Gardner   

PROPOSED LOCATION: SESW 32 090S 230E Permit Tech Review:

SURFACE: 1105 FSL 2631 FWL Engineering Review:

BOTTOM: 1105 FSL 2631 FWL Geology Review:

COUNTY: UINTAH 

LATITUDE: 39.98835 LONGITUDE: -109.35013

UTM SURF EASTINGS: 640864.00 NORTHINGS: 4427558.00

FIELD NAME: NATURAL BUTTES   

LEASE TYPE: 3 - State   

LEASE NUMBER: ML3355             PROPOSED PRODUCING FORMATION(S): MESA VERDE 

SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State COALBED METHANE: NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

PLAT R649-2-3.

Bond: STATE/FEE - 6196017      Unit:  CHAPITA WELLS 

Potash R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5      

Oil Shale 190-3 R649-3-3. Exception

Oil Shale 190-13  Drilling Unit 

Water Permit: 49-225           Board Cause No:  Cause 179-8

RDCC Review:           Effective Date:  8/10/1999

Fee Surface Agreement           Siting:  Suspends General Siting

Intent to Commingle R649-3-11. Directional Drill

 Commingling Approved  

Comments:          Presite Completed
                  RIGSKID FR 4304750064: 

Stipulations:         12 - Cement Volume (3) - ddoucet
                             22 - Rigskid - bhill
                             25 - Surface Casing - ddoucet

WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

I

I

APD RECEIVED: 9/11/2009 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43047507660000

WELL NAME: CWU 1400-32X

OPERATOR: EOG Resources, Inc. (N9550) PHONE NUMBER: 435 781-9111

CONTACT: Kaylene Gardner

PROPOSED LOCATION: SESW 32 090S 230E Permit Tech Review:

SURFACE: 1105 FSL 2631 FWL Engineering Review:

BOTTOM: 1105 FSL 2631 FWL Geology Review:

COUNTY: UINTAH

LATITUDE: 39.98835 LONGITUDE: -109.35013

UTM SURF EASTINGS: 640864.00 NORTHINGS: 4427558.00

FIELD NAME: NATURAL BUTTES

LEASE TYPE: 3 - State

LEASE NUMBER: ML3355 PROPOSED PRODUCING FORMATION(S): MESA VERDE

SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State COALBED METHANE: NO

I

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

PLAT R649-2-3.

Bond: STATE/FEE - 6196017 Unit: CHAPITA WELLS

Potash R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5

Oil Shale 190-3 R649-3-3. Exception

Oil Shale 190-13 Drilling Unit

Water Permit: 49-225 Board Cause No: Cause 179-8

RDCC Review: Effective Date: 8/10/1999

Fee Surface Agreement Siting: Suspends General Siting

Intent to Commingle R649-3-11. Directional Drill

Commingling Approved

I

Comments: Presite Completed
RIGSKID FR 4304750064:

Stipulations: 12 - Cement Volume (3) - ddoucet
22 - Rigskid - bhill
25 - Surface Casing -



Permit To Drill

******************
Well Name:  CWU 1400-32X

API Well Number:  43047507660000

Lease Number:  ML3355

Surface Owner:   STATE 

Approval Date:  10/13/2009

Issued to:
EOG Resources, Inc., 1060 East Highway 40, Vernal, UT 84078

Authority:
Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. §40-6-1 et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit to drill the listed
well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of Cause 179-8. The expected
producing formation or pool is the MESA VERDE Formation(s), completion into any other zones
will require filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool
will require approval in accordance with R649-3-22.

Duration:
This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous operation
is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date

General:
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to drill.

Conditions of Approval:
All conditions of approval in the Statement of Basis and RDCC comments from the CWU 1400-32
permit apply to the CWU 1400-32X well. 

Cement volume for the 4 1/2" production string shall be determined from actual hole diameter in
order to place cement from the pipe setting depth back to 2100' MD as indicated in the submitted
drilling plan. 

Surface casing shall be cemented from setting depth back to the surface. 

Additional Approvals:
The operator is required to obtain approval from the Division of Oil, Gas and mining before
performing any of the following actions during the drilling of this well:
   • Any changes to the approved drilling plan – contact Dustin Doucet
   • Significant plug back of the well – contact Dustin Doucet
   • Plug and abandonment of the well – contact Dustin Doucet

Notification Requirements:

API Well No: 43047507660000API Well No: 43047507660000

State of Utah
, DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
"- MICHAELR.STYLER

GAR . H HERT Excutiw Drotor

comrwr Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BA2A
Lieuterard Gowrver Dusion Dmctor

Permit To Drill
kkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkkk

Well Name: CWU 1400-32X
API Well Number: 43047507660000

Lease Number: ML3355
Surface Owner: STATE
Approval Date: 10/13/2009

Issued to:
EOG Resources, Inc., 1060 East Highway 40, Vernal, UT 84078

Authority:
Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. §40-6-1et seq., and Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining issues conditions of approval, and permit to drill the listed
well. This permit is issued in accordance with the requirements of Cause 179-8. The expected
producing formation or pool is the MESA VERDE Formation(s), completion into any other zones
will require filing a Sundry Notice (Form 9). Completion and commingling of more than one pool
will require approval in accordance with R649-3-22.

Duration:
This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous operation
is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date

General:
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas Conservation
General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved Application for permit to drill.

Conditions of Approval:
All conditions of approval in the Statement of Basis and RDCC comments from the CWU 1400-32
permit apply to the CWU 1400-32X well.

Cement volume for the 4 1/2" production string shall be determined from actual hole diameter in
order to place cement from the pipe setting depth back to 2100' MD as indicated in the submitted
drilling plan.

Surface casing shall be cemented from setting depth back to the surface.

Additional Approvals:
The operator is required to obtain approval from the Division of Oil, Gas and mining before
performing any of the following actions during the drilling of this well:

• Any changes to the approved drilling plan - contact Dustin Doucet
• Significant plug back of the well - contact Dustin Doucet
• Plug and abandonment of the well - contact Dustin Doucet

Notification



The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following actions during
drilling of this well:
   • Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well – contact Carol Daniels
     OR 
     submit an electronic sundry notice (pre-registration required) via the Utah Oil & Gas website
     at https://oilgas.ogm.utah.gov
   • 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment - contact Dan Jarvis
   • 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing – contact Dan Jarvis
   • Within 24 hours of making any emergency changes to the approved drilling program
     – contact Dustin Doucet
   • 24 hours prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well – contact Dan Jarvis

Contact Information:
The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their telephone numbers (please
leave a voicemail message if the person is not available to take the call):
   • Carol Daniels   801-538-5284 - office
   • Dustin Doucet  801-538-5281 - office
                              801-733-0983 - after office hours
   • Dan Jarvis        801-538-5338 - office
                              801-942-0871 - after office hours

Reporting Requirements:
All reports, forms and submittals as required by the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
will be promptly filed with the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, including but not limited to:
   • Entity Action Form (Form 6) – due within 5 days of spudding the well
   • Monthly Status Report (Form 9) – due by 5th day of the following calendar month
   • Requests to Change Plans (Form 9) – due prior to implementation
   • Written Notice of Emergency Changes (Form 9) – due within 5 days
   • Notice of Operations Suspension or Resumption (Form 9) – due prior to implementation
   • Report of Water Encountered (Form 7) – due within 30 days after completion
   • Well Completion Report (Form 8) – due within 30 days after completion or plugging

Approved By:

Gil Hunt
Associate Director, Oil & Gas 

API Well No: 43047507660000API Well No: 43047507660000

The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following actions during
drilling of this well:

• Within 24 hours following the spudding of the well - contact Carol Daniels
OR
submit an electronic sundry notice (pre-registration required) via the Utah Oil & Gas website
at https://oilgas.ogm.utah.gov

• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment - contact Dan Jarvis
• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing - contact Dan Jarvis
• Within 24 hours of making any emergency changes to the approved drilling program

- contact Dustin Doucet
• 24 hours prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well - contact Dan Jarvis

Contact Information:
The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their telephone numbers (please
leave a voicemail message if the person is not available to take the call):

• Carol Daniels 801-538-5284 - office
• Dustin Doucet 801-538-5281 - office

801-733-0983 - after office hours
•Dan Jarvis 801-538-5338 - office

801-942-0871 - after office hours

Reporting Requirements:
All reports, forms and submittals as required by the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules
will be promptly filed with the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, including but not limited to:

• Entity Action Form (Form 6) - due within 5 days of spudding the well
• Monthly Status Report (Form 9) - due by 5th day of the following calendar month
• Requests to Change Plans (Form 9) - due prior to implementation
• Written Notice of Emergency Changes (Form 9) - due within 5 days
• Notice of Operations Suspension or Resumption (Form 9) - due prior to implementation
• Report of Water Encountered (Form 7) - due within 30 days after completion
• Well Completion Report (Form 8) - due within 30 days after completion or plugging

Approved By:

Gil Hunt
Associate Director, Oil &



O

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: EOG RESOURCES INC

Well Name: CWU 1400-32X

Api No: 43-047-50766 Lease Type: STATE

Section 32 Township 09S Range 23E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor CRAIG'S ROUSTABOUT SERV RIG # BUCKET

SPUDDED:
Date 01/27/2010

Time 8:00 AM

How DRY

Dri/Iing wi/I Commence:

Reported by KENT DAVENPORT

Telephone # (435) 828-8200

Date 01/27//2010 Signed



API Well No: 43047507660000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML3355 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1400-32X 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047507660000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1105 FSL 2631 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

2/4/2010

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 No activity has occurred since spud on 1/27/2010.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Mickenzie Gates

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2/4/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-9111  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-9145

February 04, 2010

February 04, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047507660000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING "QLLEAS5E5DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITA WELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1400-32X

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
EOG Resources,Inc. 43047507660000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1105 FSL 2631 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

WENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

2/4/2010
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

No activity has occurred since spud on 1/27/2010.
Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RE ggggggy

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/4/2010

RECEIVED February 04,



API Well No: 43047507660000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML3355 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1400-32X 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047507660000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1105 FSL 2631 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

1/27/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests authorization for the disposal of
produced water at the following locations: 1. NBU 20-20B SWD 2. CWU

550-30N SWD 3. CWU 2-29 SWD 4. Red Wash Evaporation Ponds
1,2,3,4,5,6&7 5. White River Evaporation Ponds 1&2 6. Coyote Evaporation

Ponds 1&2 7. RNI Disposal 8. Hoss SWD Wells ROW# UTU86010 &
UTU897093 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Mickenzie Gates

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2/4/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-9111  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-9145

February 04, 2010

February 08, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047507660000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING "QLLEAS5E5DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITA WELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1400-32X

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
EOG Resources,Inc. 43047507660000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1105 FSL 2631 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/27/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests authorization for the disposal of
produced water at the following locations: 1. NBU 20-20B SWD 2. CWU Approved by the

550-30N SWD 3. CWU 2-29 SWD 4. Red Wash Evaporation Ponds Utah Division of
1,2,3,4,5,6&7 5. White River Evaporation Ponds 1&2 6. Coyote Evaporation Oil, Gas and Mining

Ponds 1&2 7. RNI Disposal 8. Hoss SWD Wells ROW# UTU86010 &
UTU897093 Date: February 08, 2010

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/4/2010

RECEIVED February 04,



API Well No: 43047507660000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML3355 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1400-32X 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047507660000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1105 FSL 2631 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

5/18/2010

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The referenced well was turned to sales on May 18, 2010. Please see the
attached operations summary report for drilling and completion operations

performed on the subject well.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Michelle Robles

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5/21/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-9111  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
307 276-4842

May 21, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047507660000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING "QLLEAS5E5DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITA WELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1400-32X

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
EOG Resources,Inc. 43047507660000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1105 FSL 2631 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

WENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

/ DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

5/18/2010
WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was turned to sales on May 18, 2010. Please see the
attached operations summary report for drilling and completion operationsAccepted by the

performed on the subject well. Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Michelle Robles 307 276-4842 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/21/2010

RECEIVED May 21,



WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 05−21−2010

Well Name CWU 1400−32X Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43−047−50766 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 04−10−2010 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 8,830/ 8,830 Property # 066383

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,294/ 5,281

Location Section 32, T9S, R23E, SESW, 1105 FSL & 2631 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.139

AFE No 310507 AFE Total 1,324,000 DHC / CWC 551,900/ 772,100

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #31 Start Date 10−30−2009 Release Date 04−16−2010

10−30−2009 Reported By CINDY VAN RANKEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA


1105’ FSL & 2631’ FWL (SE/SW)


SECTION 32, T9S, R23E


UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH





LAT 39.988275, LONG 109.350739 (NAD 83)


LAT 39.988308, LONG 109.350061 (NAD 27)





TRUE #31


OBJECTIVE: 8830’ MD, MESAVERDE


DW/GAS


CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECT


DD&A:  CHAPITA DEEP


NATURAL BUTTES FIELD





LEASE: ML−3355


ELEVATION:  5287.0’ NAT GL, 5281.1’ PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL WILL BE 5281’) 5297’ KB (16’)





EOG WI 100%, NRI 81.139316%

01−28−2010 Reported By KENT DEVENPORT

May 21, 2010

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 05-21-2010

Well Name CWU 1400-32X Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43-047-50766 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 04-10-2010 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 8,830/ 8,830 Property # 066383

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,294/ 5,281

Location Section 32, T9S, R23E, SESW, 1105 FSL & 2631 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.139

AFE No 310507 AFE Total 1,324,000 DHC / CWC 551,900/772,100

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #31 Start Date 10-30-2009 Release Date 04-16-2010

10-30-2009 Reported By CINDY VAN RANKEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

l l05'FSL & 2631' FWL (SE/SW)

SECTION 32, T9S, R23E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

LAT 39.988275, LONG 109.350739 (NAD 83)

LAT 39.988308, LONG 109.350061 (NAD 27)

TRUE #31

OBJECTIVE: 8830' MD, MESAVERDE

DW/GAS

CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECT

DD&A: CHAPITA DEEP

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD

LEASE: ML-3355

ELEVATION: 5287.0' NAT GL, 5281.1' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING PREP GL WILL BE 5281') 5297' KB (16')

EOG WI 100%, NRI 81.139316%

()1-28-2010 Reported By KENT DEVENPORT

RECEIVED May 21,



Well Name: CWU 1400−32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 CRAIGS ROUSTABOUT SERVICE SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 1/27/10 @ 8:00 AM. SET +/−60’ OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX. CAROL DANIELS W/UDOGM WAS NOTIFIED BY PHONE MESSAGE
AND BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 1/25/10 @ 3:00 PM.

02−08−2010 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $228,927 Completion $0 Daily Total $228,927

Cum Costs: Drilling $228,927 Completion $0 Well Total $228,927

MD 2,413 TVD 2,413 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG’S AIR RIG #2 ON 2/01/2010. DRILLED 12−1/4" HOLE TO 2396.76’ GL (2412.76’ KB).
ENCOUNTERED NO WATER. FLUID DRILLED HOLE FROM 1530’ WITH NO RETURNS.


RAN 54 JTS (2384.76’) OF 9−5/8", 36.0#, J−55, ST&C CASING WITH HALLIBURTON GUIDE SHOE AND FLOAT
COLLAR. 8 CENTRALIZERS SPACED MIDDLE OF SHOE JOINT AND EVERY COLLAR TILL GONE. LANDED @
2400.76’ KB. RDMO  AIR RIG.





MIRU HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINES AND CEMENT
VALVE TO 5000 PSIG. PUMPED 170 BBLS FRESH WATER & 20 BBLS GELLED WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF
CEMENT. MIXED & PUMPED 400 SX (84 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.6
PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT W/180.5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FCP 100 PSI. BUMPED
PLUG W/1000 PSI @ 06:00 PM, 2/05/2010. CHECKED FLOAT, FLOAT HELD. SHUT−IN CASING VALVE. NO
RETURNS. WOC 2 HOURS. 





TOP JOB # 1: MIXED & PUMPED THROUGH 6’ OF 1" PIPE 100 SX (21 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2%
CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX. NO RETURNS. WOC 2.25 HRS. 





TOP JOB # 2: MIXED & PUMPED 200 SX (42 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX.  NO RETURNS. WOC 2.5 HRS. 





TOP JOB # 3: MIXED & PUMPED 100 SX (21 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX.  NO RETURNS. WOC 2.5 HOURS.





TOP JOB # 4: MIXED & PUMPED 100 SX (21 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX.  NO RETURNS. WOC 6 HRS.  





TOP JOB # 5: MIXED & PUMPED 200 SX (42 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX.  NO RETURNS. WOC 2.5 HOURS. 





TOP JOB # 6: MIXED & PUMPED 100 SX (21 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX.  NO RETURNS. WOC 6.5 HRS.  





TOP JOB # 7: MIXED & PUMPED 50 SX (10.5 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX. NO RETURNS, WOC 2.5 HOURS. 


Page 2

May 21, 2010

Well Name: CWU 1400-32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 60 TVD 60 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SPUD NOTIFICATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 CRAIGS ROUSTABOUT SERVICE SPUD A 20" HOLE ON 1/27/10 @8:00 AM. SET +/-60' OF 14" CONDUCTOR.
CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX. CAROL DANIELS W/UDOGM WAS NOTIFIED BY PHONE MESSAGE
AND BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY EMAIL OF SPUD ON 1/25/10 @3:00 PM.

02-08-2010 Reported By KERRY SALES

DailyCosts: Drilling $228,927 Completion $0 Daily Total $228,927

Cum Costs: Drilling $228,927 Completion $0 Well Total $228,927

MD 2,413 TVD 2,413 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG'S AIR RIG #2 ON 2/01/2010. DRILLED 12-1/4" HOLE TO 2396.76' GL (2412.76' KB).
ENCOUNTERED NO WATER. FLUID DRILLED HOLE FROM 1530' WITH NO RETURNS.

RAN 54 JTS (2384.76') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#, J-55, ST&C CASING WITH HALLIBURTON GUIDE SHOE AND FLOAT
COLLAR. 8 CENTRALIZERS SPACED MIDDLE OF SHOE JOINT AND EVERY COLLAR TILL GONE. LANDED @
2400.76' KB. RDMO AIR RIG.

MIRU HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINES AND CEMENT
VALVE TO 5000 PSIG. PUMPED 170 BBLS FRESH WATER & 20 BBLS GELLED WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF
CEMENT. MIXED & PUMPED 400 SX (84 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @15.6
PPG W/YIELD OF l.15 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT W/180.5 BBLS FRESH WATER. FCP 100 PSI. BUMPED
PLUG W/1000 PSI @06:00 PM, 2/05/2010. CHECKED FLOAT, FLOAT HELD. SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. NO
RETURNS. WOC 2 HOURS.

TOP JOB # 1: MIXED & PUMPED THROUGH 6'OF 1" PIPE 100 SX (21 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2%
CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX. NO RETURNS. WOC 2.25 HRS.

TOP JOB # 2: MIXED & PUMPED 200 SX (42 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF l.17 CF/SX. NO RETURNS. WOC 2.5 HRS.

TOP JOB # 3: MIXED & PUMPED 100 SX (21 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF l.17 CF/SX. NO RETURNS. WOC 2.5 HOURS.

TOP JOB # 4: MIXED & PUMPED 100 SX (21 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX. NO RETURNS. WOC 6 HRS.

TOP JOB # 5: MIXED & PUMPED 200 SX (42 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF l.17 CF/SX. NO RETURNS. WOC 2.5 HOURS.

TOP JOB # 6: MIXED & PUMPED 100 SX (21 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF l.17 CF/SX. NO RETURNS. WOC 6.5 HRS.

TOP JOB # 7: MIXED & PUMPED 50 SX (10.5 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX. NO RETURNS, WOC 2.5 HOURS.

Page 2

RECEIVED May 21,



Well Name: CWU 1400−32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383




TOP JOB # 8: MIXED & PUMPED 50 SX (10.5 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX. RETURNS. WELL FULL AND STATIC, OBSERVE WELL FOR 1 HOUR.  








PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.





CRAIGS RIG 2 TOOK 10 SURVEYS WHILE DRILLING HOLE @ 500’ = .25 DEGREE, 1,000’ = .25 DEGREE. 1250’ =
1.25 DEGREE. 1410’ = 2.5 DEGREE, 1500’ = 1 DEGREE, 1680’ = .75 DEGREE, 1800’ = 1.5 DEGREE, 1980’ 1
DEGREE, 2130’ = 1 DEGREE AND 2340’ = 1 DEGREE. 





KERRY SALES  NOTIFIED BLM VIA ELECTRONIC FORM OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON
2/05/2010 @  03:00 PM. KERRY SALES CONTACTED CAROL DANIELS WITH UDOGM OF SURFACE CASING &
CEMENT JOB ON 2/05/2010 @ 03:00 PM.

04−10−2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $181,671 Completion $0 Daily Total $181,671

Cum Costs: Drilling $410,598 Completion $0 Well Total $410,598

MD 2,413 TVD 2,413 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO DRILL OUT CEMENT & SHOE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 00:00 18.0 HSM W/ WESTROC TRUCKING AND RIG HANDS FOR 7/10 MILE MOVE.DERRICK DOWN @ 07:00 MIRU.
TRUCKS RELEASED @ 13:00, DERRICK IN THE AIR @ 1400. PRE−SPUD WALKTHROUGH W/ TOOLPUSHER @
23:00.





00:00 04:00 4.0 RIG ON DAYWORK @ 00:00 4−10−10. HSM. NIPPLE UP & TEST BOPE. TEST HIGH 5000 PSI, UPPER AND
LOWER KELLY VALVE, SAFETY AND DART VALVE, PIPE AND BLIND RAMS, HCR, KILL LINE AND VALVE,
CHOKE LINE, CHOKE VALVE, MANIFOLD. TEST HIGH 1500 PSI HIGH  ANNULAR PREVENTER. TEST CASING
TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MINUTES. PERFORM ACCUMULATOR FUNCTION TEST. INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.


BLM NOTIFIED OF BOP TEST BY E−MAIL ON 4−7−2010 @ 21:18.


NO BLM REPRESENTATIVE TO WITNESS TEST.

04:00 06:00 2.0 HSM. R/U WEATHERFORD TRS AND PU BHA & TOOLS. TAG CEMENT @ 2290’. R/D TRS.





FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.


SAFETY MEETINGS − RIG MOVE, TEST BOPE, P/U BHA.


FUEL − 6500, DEL − 9200 ON HAND, USED − 700.

04−11−2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $25,402 Completion $0 Daily Total $25,402

Cum Costs: Drilling $436,000 Completion $0 Well Total $436,000

MD 4,575 TVD 4,575 Progress 2,162 Days 1 MW 10.3 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 4575’

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP. FC @ 2355’, SHOE @ 2400’. 

08:00 16:00 8.0 DRILLING 2413’ − 3259’. WOB 15K, RPM 65/73, SPP 2100 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 106 FPH.  FIT FOR 10.5 EMW @
2415’.

16:00 16:30 0.5 SURVEY 3179 @ 1.18 DEG.
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Well Name: CWU 1400-32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

TOP JOB # 8: MIXED & PUMPED 50 SX (10.5 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT W/2% CACL2. MIXED CEMENT @
15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.17 CF/SX. RETURNS. WELL FULL AND STATIC, OBSERVE WELL FOR 1 HOUR.

PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

CRAIGS RIG 2 TOOK 10 SURVEYSWHILE DRILLING HOLE @500' =
.25 DEGREE, 1,000' =

.25 DEGREE. 1250' =

1.25 DEGREE. 1410' = 2.5 DEGREE, 1500' = 1 DEGREE, 1680' =
.75 DEGREE, 1800' = 1.5 DEGREE, 1980' l

DEGREE, 2130' = 1 DEGREE AND 2340' = 1 DEGREE.

KERRY SALES NOTIFIED BLM VIA ELECTRONIC FORM OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON
2/05/2010 @ 03:00 PM. KERRY SALES CONTACTED CAROL DANIELS WITH UDOGM OF SURFACE CASING &
CEMENT JOB ON 2/05/2010 @03:00 PM.

04-10-2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $181,671 Completion $0 Daily Total $181,671

Cum Costs: Drilling $410,598 Completion $0 Well Total $410,598

MD 2,413 TVD 2,413 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO DRILL OUT CEMENT & SHOE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 00:00 18.0 HSM W/ WESTROC TRUCKING AND RIG HANDS FOR 7/10 MILE MOVE.DERRICK DOWN @07:00 MIRU.
TRUCKS RELEASED @13:00, DERRICK IN THE AIR @1400. PRE-SPUD WALKTHROUGH W/ TOOLPUSHER @
23:00.

00:00 04:00 4.0 RIG ON DAYWORK @00:00 4-10-10. HSM. NIPPLE UP & TEST BOPE. TEST HIGH 5000 PSI, UPPER AND
LOWER KELLY VALVE, SAFETY AND DART VALVE, PIPE AND BLIND RAMS, HCR, KILL LINE AND VALVE,
CHOKE LINE, CHOKE VALVE, MANIFOLD. TEST HIGH 1500 PSI HIGH ANNULAR PREVENTER. TEST CASING
TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MINUTES. PERFORM ACCUMULATOR FUNCTION TEST. INSTALL WEAR BUSHING.

BLM NOTIFIED OF BOP TEST BY E-MAIL ON 4-7-2010 @21:18.

NO BLM REPRESENTATIVE TO WITNESS TEST.

04:00 06:00 2.0 HSM. R/U WEATHERFORD TRS AND PU BHA & TOOLS. TAG CEMENT @2290'. R/D TRS.

FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.

SAFETY MEETINGS - RIG MOVE, TEST BOPE, P/U BHA.

FUEL - 6500, DEL - 9200 ON HAND, USED - 700.

04-11-2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $25,402 Completion $0 Daily Total $25,402

Cum Costs: Drilling $436,000 Completion $0 Well Total $436,000

MD 4,575 TVD 4,575 Progress 2,162 Days 1 MW 10.3 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @4575'

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL CEMENT/FLOAT EQUIP. FC @2355', SHOE @2400'.

08:00 16:00 8.0 DRILLING 2413'- 3259'. WOB 15K, RPM 65/73, SPP 2100 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 106 FPH. FIT FOR 10.5 EMW @
2415'.

16:00 16:30 0.5 SURVEY 3179 @1.18 DEG.
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Well Name: CWU 1400−32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

16:30 02:30 10.0 DRILLING 3259’ − 4291. WOB 15K, RPM 65/78, SPP 2000 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 103 FPH.

02:30 03:00 0.5 SURVEY 4220’ @ 2.3 DEG.

03:00 06:00 3.0 DRILLING 4291’ − 4575’ . WOB 15K, RPM 65/78, SPP 2100 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 95 FPH.





FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.


SAFETY MEETINGS − LOADING PIPE RACK.


FUEL − 7800,  USED − 1400.





06:00 SPUD 7 7/8" HOLE @ 08:00 HRS, 4/10/10.

04−12−2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,749 Completion $598 Daily Total $36,347

Cum Costs: Drilling $471,749 Completion $598 Well Total $472,347

MD 6,109 TVD 6,109 Progress 1,534 Days 2 MW 10.9 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 6109’

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:30 7.5 DRILLING 4575’ − 5233’. WOB 20K, RPM 65/78, SPP 2100 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 88 FPH.

13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

14:00 06:00 16.0 DRILLING 5233’ − 6109’. WOB 20K, RPM 65/78, SPP 2100 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 55 FPH.





BUCK CANYON 5616’ − NORTH HORN 6186’


FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.


SAFETY MEETINGS − CONNECTIONS.


FUEL − 6028,  USED − 1772.

04−13−2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,314 Completion $7,813 Daily Total $37,127

Cum Costs: Drilling $501,064 Completion $8,411 Well Total $509,475

MD 7,306 TVD 7,306 Progress 1,197 Days 3 MW 11.0 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 7306’

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:30 6.5 DRILLING 6109’− 6424’. WOB 20K, RPM 55/70, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 49 FPH.


NORTH HORN 6186’ − PRICE RIVER 6477’

12:30 13:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG

13:00 06:00 17.0 DRILLING 6424’ − 7306’. WOB 20K, RPM 50/68, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 52 FPH.


PRICE RIVER 6477’ − MIDDLE PRICE 7357’





FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.


SAFETY MEETINGS − CONNECTIONS.


FUEL − 4255,  USED − 1773.

04−14−2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $26,140 Completion $543 Daily Total $26,683

Cum Costs: Drilling $527,204 Completion $8,954 Well Total $536,158
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Well Name: CWU 1400-32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

16:30 02:30 10.0 DRILLING 3259'- 4291. WOB 15K, RPM 65/78, SPP 2000 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 103 FPH.

02:30 03:00 0.5 SURVEY 4220' @2.3 DEG.

03:00 06:00 3.0 DRILLING 4291'- 4575'. WOB 15K, RPM 65/78, SPP 2100 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 95 FPH.

FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.

SAFETY MEETINGS - LOADING PIPE RACK.

FUEL - 7800, USED - 1400.

06:00 SPUD 7 7/8" HOLE @08:00 HRS, 4/10/10.

04-12-2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,749 Completion $598 Daily Total $36,347

Cum Costs: Drilling $471,749 Completion $598 Well Total $472,347

MD 6,109 TVD 6,109 Progress 1,534 Days 2 MW 10.9 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @6109'

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:30 7.5 DRILLING 4575'- 5233'. WOB 20K, RPM 65/78, SPP 2100 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 88 FPH.

13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

14:00 06:00 16.0 DRILLING 5233'- 6109'. WOB 20K, RPM 65/78, SPP 2100 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 55 FPH.

BUCK CANYON 5616'- NORTH HORN 6186'

FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.

SAFETY MEETINGS - CONNECTIONS.

FUEL - 6028, USED - 1772.

04-13-2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,314 Completion $7,813 Daily Total $37,127

Cum Costs: Drilling $501,064 Completion $8,411 Well Total $509,475

MD 7,306 TVD 7,306 Progress 1,197 Days 3 MW 11.0 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @7306'

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:30 6.5 DRILLING 6109'- 6424'. WOB 20K, RPM 55/70, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 49 FPH.

NORTH HORN 6186'- PRICE RIVER 6477'

12:30 13:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG

13:00 06:00 17.0 DRILLING 6424' - 7306'. WOB 20K, RPM 50/68, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 52 FPH.

PRICE RIVER 6477'- MIDDLE PRICE 7357'

FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.

SAFETY MEETINGS - CONNECTIONS.

FUEL - 4255, USED - 1773.

04-14-2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $26,140 Completion $543 Daily Total $26,683

Cum Costs: Drilling $527,204 Completion $8,954 Well Total $536,158
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Well Name: CWU 1400−32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

MD 8,200 TVD 8,200 Progress 894 Days 4 MW 11.1 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH FOR NEW BIT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:30 7.5 DRILLING 7306 − 7839’ − . WOB 20K, RPM 55/70, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 71 FPH.


LOWER PRICE RIVER 8134’.

13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

14:00 00:00 10.0 DRILLING 7839’ − 8200’. WOB 20K, RPM 55/70, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 36’ FPH.


SEGO 8619’.

00:00 00:30 0.5 CIRCULATE, PUMP PILL.

00:30 02:00 1.5 TOOH TO 5000’.

02:00 06:00 4.0 WORK TIGHT HOLE 5000 − 4700’ CONTINUE TOOH.





FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.


CHECK COM,  BOP DRILL


SAFETY MEETINGS − LAST DAY.


FUEL − 2567,  USED − 1688.

04−15−2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $38,435 Completion $0 Daily Total $38,435

Cum Costs: Drilling $565,640 Completion $8,954 Well Total $574,594

MD 8,619 TVD 8,619 Progress 419 Days 5 MW 11.3 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @ 8619’

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:30 5.5 WORK TIGHT HOLE 4310 − 4400’, CONTINUE TOOH.


NOTIFIED BLM OF CSG RUN @ 10:00 AM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 LD JARS, REAMERS, MOTOR, CHANGE OUT BIT, PU MOTOR, & JARS. 

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

12:30 20:00 7.5 TIH W/ BHA #2, & BIT #2. WORK TIGHT SPOTS 4275 −5010’.

20:00 21:00 1.0 PU PIPE AND WASH TO BOTTOM 8150 −8200’.

21:00 06:00 9.0 DRILLING 8200’ − 8619. WOB 20K, RPM 55/68, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 46’ FPH.


SEGO 8619’.





FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.


CHECK COM,  BOP DRILL


SAFETY MEETINGS − PU DRILL PIPE.


FUEL − 3534,  USED − 1033.

04−16−2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $30,130 Completion $0 Daily Total $30,130

Cum Costs: Drilling $595,771 Completion $8,954 Well Total $604,725

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 211 Days 6 MW 11.4 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNNING 4−1/2" CASING
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Well Name: CWU 1400-32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

MD 8,200 TVD 8,200 Progress 894 Days 4 MW 11.1 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TOH FOR NEW BIT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:30 7.5 DRILLING 7306 - 7839' -
. WOB 20K, RPM 55/70, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 71 FPH.

LOWER PRICE RIVER 8134'.

13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

14:00 00:00 10.0 DRILLING 7839'- 8200'. WOB 20K, RPM 55/70, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 36' FPH.

SEGO 8619'.

00:00 00:30 0.5 CIRCULATE, PUMP PILL.

00:30 02:00 1.5 TOOH TO 5000'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 WORK TIGHT HOLE 5000 - 4700' CONTINUE TOOH.

FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.

CHECK COM, BOP DRILL

SAFETY MEETINGS - LAST DAY.

FUEL - 2567, USED - 1688.

04-15-2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $38,435 Completion $0 Daily Total $38,435

Cum Costs: Drilling $565,640 Completion $8,954 Well Total $574,594

MD 8,619 TVD 8,619 Progress 419 Days 5 MW 11.3 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING @8619'

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:30 5.5 WORK TIGHT HOLE 4310 - 4400', CONTINUE TOOH.

NOTIFIED BLM OF CSG RUN @10:00 AM.

l1:30 12:00 0.5 LD JARS, REAMERS, MOTOR, CHANGE OUT BIT, PU MOTOR, & JARS.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

12:30 20:00 7.5 TIH W/ BHA #2, & BIT #2. WORK TIGHT SPOTS 4275 -5010'.

20:00 21:00 1.0 PU PIPE AND WASH TO BOTTOM 8150 -8200'.

21:00 06:00 9.0 DRILLING 8200'- 8619. WOB 20K, RPM 55/68, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 46'FPH.

SEGO 8619'.

FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.

CHECK COM, BOP DRILL

SAFETY MEETINGS - PU DRILL PIPE.

FUEL - 3534, USED - 1033.

04-16-2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $30,130 Completion $0 Daily Total $30,130

Cum Costs: Drilling $595,771 Completion $8,954 Well Total $604,725

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 211 Days 6 MW 11.4 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNNING 4-1/2" CASING
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Well Name: CWU 1400−32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILLING 8619 − 8824’ . WOB 20K, RPM 55/68, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 41’ FPH.


SEGO 8619’.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

11:30 12:00 0.5 DRILLING 8824 − 8830’. WOB 20K, RPM 55/68, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 12’ FPH. REACHED TD @ 12:00
HRS, 4/15/10.





12:00 13:00 1.0 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP AND PUMP PILL.

13:00 19:00 6.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIP TO HWDP,  WORK TIGHT SPOTS.

19:00 20:00 1.0 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION TO LDDP. HSM. R/U WESTATES TRS. MIX AND PUMP PILL.

20:00 02:30 6.5 LDDP. BREAK KELLY. L/D BHA. PULL WEAR BUSHING.

02:30 06:00 3.5 HSM. RUN 4000’ OF 4 1/2", 11.6#, N−80, LT&C CSG, DETAILS ON NEXT REPORT.





FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.


CHECK COM,  BOP DRILL.


MUD WT. 11.4+ VIS


SAFETY MEETINGS − RUN CSG.


FUEL − 2567,  USED − 967.

04−17−2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $24,798 Completion $146,848 Daily Total $171,646

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $155,802 Well Total $776,371

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 7 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 HSM. RUN 4 1/2", 11.6#, N−80, LT&C CSG AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE @ 8825’, 1 JT CSG40.30, FLOAT COLLAR
@ 8782’, 58 JTS CSG, MJ @ 6448’, 62 JTS CSG, MJ @ 3963’, 98 JTS CSG (219 TOTAL). P/U JT # 220, TAG BOTTOM
@ 8830’. L/D JT # 220. P/U MCH, LJ. INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER, LAND MCH FOR CEMENT. DROP BALL.
RAN TURBULIZERS ON BOTTOM THREE JOINTS, 25 BOW SPRING CENTRALIZERS ON EVERY THIRD JT TO
5689’. R/D TRS.





07:00 08:00 1.0 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION FOR CEMENT.

08:00 12:00 4.0 HSM, R/U HALLIBURTON. PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 5000 PSI, CEMENT WELL AS FOLLOWS: PUMP 20 BBLS
MUD FLUSH, MIX AND PUMP 380 SX (124 BBLS, 695.4 CU/FT) LEAD HIGHBOND 75 CEMENT @ 12 PPG, 1.83
YLD, H2O 9.78 GAL/SK + 4% BENTONITE + .3% VERSASET. MIX AND PUMP 1290 SX (338 BBLS, 1896.3 CU/FT)
TAIL EXTENDACEM CEMENT @ 13.5 PPG, 1.47 YLD, H2O 6.96 GAL/SK + .125 LBM POLY−E−FLAKE. WASH UP
TO RIG TANK, MANUALLY DROP PLUG AND DISPLACE W/136 BBLS FRESH WATER. FULL RETURNS
THROUGHOUT − 8 BBLS CEMENT TO SURFACE.  MAX PRESSURE 2500 PSI, BUMPED PLUG TO 4000 PSI.
BLED BACK 2 BBLS, FLOATS HELD.  PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1500 PSI, HOLD FOR 1 HOUR. BLED OFF
CEMENT HEAD, FLOATS HELD. PACK OFF AND TEST HANGER TO 5000 PSI. FINISH R/D HALLIBURTON.





CLEAN MUD TANKS.

12:00 06:00 18.0 RDRT ,WELD MUFFLER ON LP, BUILD UPSTEP ON FLOOR.





BLM NOTIFIED BY E−MAIL 4/14/2010 @ 10:00, WERE NOT PRESENT TO WITNESS.


FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.


SAFETY MEETINGS − RDRT.


FUEL − 2000, USED − 567.
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Well Name: CWU 1400-32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 1I:00 5.0 DRILLING 8619 - 8824' . WOB 20K, RPM 55/68, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 41' FPH.

SEGO 8619'.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

l1:30 12:00 0.5 DRILLING 8824 - 8830'. WOB 20K, RPM 55/68, SPP 2300 PSI, DP 350 PSI, ROP 12' FPH. REACHED TD @12:00
HRS, 4/15/10.

12:00 13:00 1.0 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP AND PUMP PILL.

13:00 19:00 6.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIP TO HWDP, WORK TIGHT SPOTS.

19:00 20:00 1.0 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION TO LDDP. HSM. R/U WESTATES TRS. MIX AND PUMP PILL.

20:00 02:30 6.5 LDDP. BREAK KELLY. L/D BHA. PULL WEAR BUSHING.

02:30 06:00 3.5 HSM. RUN 4000' OF 4 1/2", 11.6#, N-80, LT&C CSG, DETAILS ON NEXT REPORT.

FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.

CHECK COM, BOP DRILL.

MUD WT. l1.4+ VIS

SAFETY MEETINGS - RUN CSG.

FUEL - 2567, USED - 967.

04-17-2010 Reported By KEITH KAROW

DailyCosts: Drilling $24,798 Completion $146,848 Daily Total $171,646

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $155,802 Well Total $776,371

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 7 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 HSM. RUN 4 1/2", l1.6#, N-80, LT&C CSG AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE @8825', 1 JT CSG40.30, FLOAT COLLAR

@8782', 58 JTS CSG, MJ @6448', 62 JTS CSG, MJ @3963', 98 JTS CSG (219 TOTAL). P/U JT # 220, TAG BOTTOM

@8830'. L/D JT # 220. P/U MCH, LJ. INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER, LAND MCH FOR CEMENT. DROP BALL.
RAN TURBULIZERS ON BOTTOM THREE JOINTS, 25 BOW SPRING CENTRALIZERS ON EVERY THIRD JT TO
5689'. R/D TRS.

07:00 08:00 1.0 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION FOR CEMENT.

08:00 12:00 4.0 HSM, R/U HALLIBURTON. PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 5000 PSI, CEMENT WELL AS FOLLOWS: PUMP 20 BBLS
MUD FLUSH, MIX AND PUMP 380 SX (124 BBLS, 695.4 CU/FT) LEAD HIGHBOND 75 CEMENT @12 PPG, 1.83
YLD, H2O 9.78 GAL/SK + 4% BENTONITE + .3% VERSASET. MIX AND PUMP 1290 SX (338 BBLS, 1896.3 CU/FT)
TAIL EXTENDACEM CEMENT @13.5 PPG, 1.47 YLD, H2O 6.96 GAL/SK +

.125 LBM POLY-E-FLAKE. WASH UP
TO RIG TANK, MANUALLY DROP PLUG AND DISPLACE W/136 BBLS FRESH WATER. FULL RETURNS
THROUGHOUT - 8 BBLS CEMENT TO SURFACE. MAX PRESSURE 2500 PSI, BUMPED PLUG TO 4000 PSI.
BLED BACK 2 BBLS, FLOATS HELD. PRESSURE BACK UP TO 1500 PSI, HOLD FOR 1 HOUR. BLED OFF
CEMENT HEAD, FLOATS HELD. PACK OFF AND TEST HANGER TO 5000 PSI. FINISH R/D HALLIBURTON.

CLEAN MUD TANKS.

12:00 06:00 18.0 RDRT ,WELD MUFFLER ON LP, BUILD UPSTEP ON FLOOR.

BLM NOTIFIED BY E-MAIL 4/14/2010 @10:00, WERE NOT PRESENT TO WITNESS.

FULL CREWS, NO ACCIDENTS.

SAFETY MEETINGS - RDRT.

FUEL -2000, USED - 567.
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Well Name: CWU 1400−32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

RIG MOVE 5/10 MILE TO CWU 1324−32 AT 07:00 04−17−2010 WITH WESTROC TRUCKING.


TRANSFER 5 JTS 4 1/2", 11.6#, N−80, LTC CSG (39.66,40.29,39.72,39.15,40.59’ )  TOTAL 199.41’ THREADS OFF) TO
CWU 1324−32.


TRANSFER 2 MJ (19.64’, 20.75’ TOTAL 40.39’ THREADS OFF) TO CWU 1324−32.


TRANSFER 2000 GALS DIESEL FUEL @ $2.955/GAL TO CWU 1324−32.





06:00 RIG RELEASED @ 12:00 HRS, 04−16−2010.


CASING POINT COST $614,170

04−21−2010 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $18,500 Daily Total $18,500

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $174,302 Well Total $794,871

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 8 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. LOG WITH CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FROM 8756’ TO 60’. EST CEMENT TOP @ 1220’.
RDWL. 

05−06−2010 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $1,623 Daily Total $1,623

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $175,925 Well Total $796,494

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 9 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 NU 10M FRAC TREE. PRESSURE TESTED FRAC TREE & CASING TO 6500 PSIG. WO COMPLETION.

05−12−2010 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $818 Daily Total $818

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $176,743 Well Total $797,312

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 8034’−8586’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 STAGE #1: RU CUTTERS WIRELINE & PERFORATE LPR FROM 8308’−09’, 8315’−16’, 8320’−21’, 8330’−31’,
8410’−11’, 8413’−14’, 8438’−39’, 8476’−77’, 8544’−45’, 8555’−56’, 8573’−74’, 8585’−86’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEG
PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL (WSI 7360), 7390
GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 27313 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/95100# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5
PPG. MTP 5639 PSIG. MTR 50.6 BPM. ATP 4490 PSIG. ATR 47.2 BPM. ISIP 2777 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE #2: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8255’. PERFORATE MPR/LPR FROM 8034’−35’, 8051’−52’, 8082’−83’,
8101’−02’, 8107’−08’, 8117’−18’, 8126’−27’, 8138’−39’, 8166’−67’, 8177’−78’, 8187’−88’, 8203’−04’, 8231’−32’,
8235’−36’ @ 2 SPF & 180 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO
500), 165 GAL (WSI 7360), 7397 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 40860 GAL 16# DELTA 200
W/142500# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5944 PSIG. MTR 50.8 BPM. ATP 4573 PSIG. ATR 48 BPM. ISIP 3226 PSIG.
RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05−13−2010 Reported By MCCURDY
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May 21, 2010

Well Name: CWU 1400-32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

RIG MOVE 5/10 MILE TO CWU 1324-32 AT 07:00 04-17-2010 WITH WESTROC TRUCKING.

TRANSFER 5 JTS 4 1/2", 11.6#, N-80, LTC CSG (39.66,40.29,39.72,39.15,40.59') TOTAL 199.41' THREADS OFF) TO
CWU 1324-32.

TRANSFER 2 MJ (19.64', 20.75' TOTAL 40.39' THREADS OFF) TO CWU 1324-32.

TRANSFER 2000 GALS DIESEL FUEL @$2.955/GAL TO CWU 1324-32.

06:00 RIG RELEASED @12:00 HRS, 04-16-2010.

CASING POINT COST $614,170
04-21-2010 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $18,500 Daily Total $18,500

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $174,302 Well Total $794,871

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 8 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. LOG WITH CBL/CCL/VDL/GR FROM 8756' TO 60'. EST CEMENT TOP @1220'.
RDWL.

05-06-2010 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $1,623 Daily Total $1,623

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $175,925 Well Total $796,494

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 9 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 NU 10M FRAC TREE. PRESSURE TESTED FRAC TREE & CASING TO 6500 PSIG. WO COMPLETION.

05-12-2010 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $818 Daily Total $818

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $176,743 Well Total $797,312

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 8034'-8586' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 STAGE #1: RU CUTTERS WIRELINE & PERFORATE LPR FROM 8308'-09', 8315'-16', 8320'-21', 8330'-31',
8410'-l l', 8413'-14', 8438'-39', 8476'-77', 8544'-45', 8555'-56', 8573'-74', 8585'-86' @3 SPF & 120 DEG
PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL (WSI 7360), 7390
GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 27313 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/95100# 20/40 SAND @2-5

PPG. MTP 5639 PSIG. MTR 50.6 BPM. ATP 4490 PSIG. ATR 47.2 BPM. ISIP 2777 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.

STAGE #2: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8255'. PERFORATE MPR/LPR FROM 8034'-35', 8051'-52', 8082'-83',
8101'-02', 8107'-08', 8117'-18', 8126'-27', 8138'-39', 8166'-67', 8177'-78', 8187'-88', 8203'-04', 8231'-32',
8235'-36' @2 SPF & 180 DEG PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO
500), 165 GAL (WSI 7360), 7397 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 40860 GAL 16# DELTA 200
W/142500# 20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5944 PSIG. MTR 50.8 BPM. ATP 4573 PSIG. ATR 48 BPM. ISIP 3226 PSIG.
RD HALLIBURTON. SDFN.

05-13-2010 Reported By MCCURDY
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Well Name: CWU 1400−32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $317,757 Daily Total $317,757

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $494,500 Well Total $1,115,069

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 6492’−8586’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO MIRUSU

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 STAGE #3: SICP 2028 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8016’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 7852’−53’, 7864’−65’,
7868’−69’, 7888’−89’, 7900’−01’, 7907’−08’, 7914’−15’, 7919’−20’, 7947’−48’, 7951’−52’, 7968’−69’, 7973’−74’,
7993’−94’, 7999’−8000’ @ 2 SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING
W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL (WSI 7360), 7402 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 32393 GAL
16# DELTA 200 W/111800# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5126 PSIG. MTR 50.5 BPM. ATP 4557 PSIG. ATR 47.8
BPM. ISIP 3378 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE #4: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7840’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 7648’−49’, 7654’−55’, 7673’−74’, 7681’−82’,
7696’−97’, 7701’−02’, 7710’−11’, 7719’−20’, 7753’−54’, 7766’−67’, 7783’−84’, 7801’−02’, 7809’−10’, 7824’−25’ @ 2
SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL
(WSI 7360), 7336 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 48368 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/169300#
20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5563 PSIG. MTR 50.8 BPM. ATP 4219 PSIG. ATR 48.5 BPM. ISIP 2929 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.





STAGE #5: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7540’. PERFORATE MPR FROM 7357’−58’, 7363’−64’, 7393’−94’, 7400’−01’,
7405’−06’, 7430’−31’, 7433’−34’, 7456’−57’, 7474’−75’, 7497’−98’, 7501’−02’, 7506’−07’, 7514’−15’, 7521’−22’ @ 2
SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL
(WSI 7360), 7431 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 33473 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/117100#
20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5847 PSIG. MTR 51.7 BPM. ATP 4451 PSIG. ATR 47.8 BPM. ISIP 2455 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.





STAGE #6: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7340’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7185’−86’, 7197’−98’, 7202’−03’, 7215’−16’,
7218’−19’, 7238’−39’, 7243’−44’, 7265’−66’, 7273’−74’, 7281’−82’, 7321’−22’, 7325’−26’ @ 3 SPF & 120 DEGREE
PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL (WSI 7360), 7496
GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 26263 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/90500# 20/40 SAND @ 2−5
PPG. MTP 5989 PSIG. MTR 52.4 BPM. ATP 5011 PSIG. ATR 44.8 BPM. ISIP 2326 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





STAGE #7: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7150’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 6824’−25’, 6834’−35’, 6859’−60’, 6910’−11’,
6918’−19’, 6970’−71’, 6983’−84’, 7003’−04’, 7014’−15’, 7049’−50’, 7078’−79’, 7083’−84’, 7118’−19’, 7125’−26’ @ 2
SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL
(WSI 7360), 7269 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9300# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 43505 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/153700#
20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5588 PSIG. MTR 50.8 BPM. ATP 3925 PSIG. ATR 48.9 BPM. ISIP 2420 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.





STAGE #8: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 6800’. PERFORATE UPR FROM 6492’−93’, 6510’−11’, 6529’−30’, 6537’−38’,
6579’−80’, 6604’−05’, 6614’−15’, 6623’−24’, 6632’−33’, 6676’−77’, 6688’−89’, 6698’−99’, 6774’−75’, 6781’−82’ @ 2
SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL
(WSI 7360), 7407 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 44169 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/157100#
20/40 SAND @ 2−5 PPG. MTP 5339 PSIG. MTR 51.8 BPM. ATP 3542 PSIG. ATR 48.7 BPM. ISIP 2461 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.





RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 6384’. RD CUTTERS WL. SDFN.

05−15−2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $20,063 Daily Total $20,063

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $514,563 Well Total $1,135,132

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
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Well Name: CWU 1400-32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $317,757 Daily Total $317,757

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $494,500 Well Total $1,115,069

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 6492'-8586' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO MIRUSU

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 STAGE #3: SICP 2028 PSIG. RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 8016'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 7852'-53', 7864'-65',
7868'-69', 7888'-89', 7900'-Ol', 7907'-08', 7914'-15', 7919'-20', 7947'-48', 7951'-52', 7968'-69', 7973'-74',
7993'-94', 7999'-8000'@ 2 SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING
W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL (WSI 7360), 7402 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 32393 GAL
16# DELTA 200 W/1ll800#20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5126 PSIG. MTR 50.5 BPM. ATP 4557 PSIG. ATR 47.8
BPM. ISIP 3378 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.

STAGE #4: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7840'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 7648'-49', 7654'-55', 7673'-74', 7681'-82',
7696'-97', 7701'-02', 7710'-1l', 7719'-20', 7753'-54', 7766'-67', 7783'-84', 7801'-02', 7809'-10', 7824'-25' @2
SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL
(WSI 7360), 7336 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500#20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 48368 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/169300#
20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5563 PSIG. MTR 50.8 BPM. ATP 4219 PSIG. ATR 48.5 BPM. ISIP 2929 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.

STAGE #5: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7540'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 7357'-58', 7363'-64', 7393'-94', 7400'-Ol',
7405'-06', 7430'-31', 7433'-34', 7456'-57', 7474'-75', 7497'-98', 7501'-02', 7506'-07', 7514'-15', 7521'-22' @2
SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL
(WSI 7360), 7431 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 33473 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/117100#
20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5847 PSIG. MTR 51.7 BPM. ATP 4451 PSIG. ATR 47.8 BPM. ISIP 2455 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.

STAGE #6: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7340'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7185'-86', 7197'-98', 7202'-03', 7215'-16',
7218'-19', 7238'-39', 7243'-44', 7265'-66', 7273'-74', 7281'-82', 7321'-22', 7325'-26' @3 SPF & 120 DEGREE
PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL (WSI 7360), 7496
GAL 16# LINEAR W/9600# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 26263 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/90500# 20/40 SAND @2-5

PPG. MTP 5989 PSIG. MTR 52.4 BPM. ATP 5011 PSIG. ATR 44.8 BPM. ISIP 2326 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.

STAGE #7: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 7150'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 6824'-25', 6834'-35', 6859'-60', 6910'-11',
6918'-19', 6970'-71', 6983'-84', 7003'-04', 7014'-15', 7049'-50', 7078'-79', 7083'-84', 7118'-19', 7125'-26' @2
SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL
(WSI 7360), 7269 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9300# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 43505 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/153700#
20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5588 PSIG. MTR 50.8 BPM. ATP 3925 PSIG. ATR 48.9 BPM. ISIP 2420 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.

STAGE #8: RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 6800'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 6492'-93', 6510'-1l', 6529'-30', 6537'-38',
6579'-80', 6604'-05', 6614'-15', 6623'-24', 6632'-33', 6676'-77', 6688'-89', 6698'-99', 6774'-75', 6781'-82'@ 2
SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/55 GAL (BIO 500), 165 GAL
(WSI 7360), 7407 GAL 16# LINEAR W/9500# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 44169 GAL 16# DELTA 200 W/157100#
20/40 SAND @2-5 PPG. MTP 5339 PSIG. MTR 51.8 BPM. ATP 3542 PSIG. ATR 48.7 BPM. ISIP 2461 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.

RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 6384'. RD CUTTERS WL. SDFN.

05-15-2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $20,063 Daily Total $20,063

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $514,563 Well Total $1,135,132

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
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RECEIVED May 21,



Well Name: CWU 1400−32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 6492’−8586’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POST FRAC CLEAN OUT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 0 PSIG. MIRUSU. ND FRAC TREE & NU BOP.  RIH W/BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 6384’. RU TO DRILL OUT
PLUGS.  SDFN.

05−18−2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $53,418 Daily Total $53,418

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $567,981 Well Total $1,188,550

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 6492’−8586’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 0 PSIG. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @ 6384’, 6800’, 7150’, 7340’, 7540’, 7840’, 8016’, & 8255’.
CLEANED OUT TO 8690’. LANDED TUBING @ 7363’ KB. ND BOP & NU TREE. PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.
RDMOSU.





FLOWED 15 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 1350 PSIG. CP 1750 PSIG. 63 BFPH. RECOVERED 1006 BLW. 


8594 BLWTR.





TUBING DETAIL					LENGTH





PUMP OFF BIT SUB				.91’


1 JT 2−3/8" 4.7# N−80 TBG 	 			32.48’


XN NIPPLE					1.30’


225 JTS 2−3/8" 4.7# N−80 TBG 				7312.10’


BELOW KB					16.00’


LANDED @					7362.79’ KB

05−19−2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $5,165 Daily Total $5,165

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $573,146 Well Total $1,193,715

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 6492’−8586’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST TO SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 INITIAL PRODUCTION. OPENING PRESSURE: TP 1250 PSIG & CP 1900 PSIG. TURNED WELL OVER TO
QUESTAR SALES AT 10:30 AM, 5/18/10. FLOWED 1200 MCFD RATE ON 24/64" POS CHOKE.  STATIC 271.
QUESTAR METER #008477.





FLOWED THROUGH TEST UNIT TO SALES. 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 1100 PSIG. CP 2050 PSIG. 54 BFPH.
RECOVERED 1254 BLW. 7340 BLWTR. 931 MCFD RATE.





FLOWBACK UNIT − ON TODAY.

05−20−2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,935 Daily Total $2,935
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Well Name: CWU 1400-32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 6492'-8586' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POST FRAC CLEAN OUT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 0 PSIG. MIRUSU. ND FRAC TREE & NU BOP. RIH W/BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 6384'. RU TO DRILL OUT
PLUGS. SDFN.

05-18-2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $53,418 Daily Total $53,418

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $567,981 Well Total $1,188,550

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 6492'-8586' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 0 PSIG. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @6384', 6800', 7150', 7340', 7540', 7840', 8016', & 8255'.
CLEANED OUT TO 8690'. LANDED TUBING @7363' KB. ND BOP & NU TREE. PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.
RDMOSU.

FLOWED 15 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 1350 PSIG. CP 1750 PSIG. 63 BFPH. RECOVERED 1006 BLW.

8594 BLWTR.

TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

PUMP OFF BIT SUB .91'

1 JT 2-3/8" 4.7# N-80 TBG 32.48'

XN NIPPLE 1.30'

225 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# N-80 TBG 7312.10'

BELOW KB 16.00'

LANDED @ 7362.79' KB

05-19-2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $5,165 Daily Total $5,165

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $573,146 Well Total $1,193,715

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 6492'-8586' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST TO SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 INITIAL PRODUCTION. OPENING PRESSURE: TP 1250 PSIG & CP 1900 PSIG. TURNED WELL OVER TO
QUESTAR SALES AT 10:30 AM, 5/18/10. FLOWED 1200 MCFD RATE ON 24/64" POS CHOKE. STATIC 271.
QUESTAR METER #008477.

FLOWED THROUGH TEST UNIT TO SALES. 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP l100 PSIG. CP 2050 PSIG. 54 BFPH.
RECOVERED 1254 BLW. 7340 BLWTR. 931 MCFD RATE.

FLOWBACK UNIT - ON TODAY.

05-20-2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,935 Daily Total $2,935
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RECEIVED May 21,



Well Name: CWU 1400−32X Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 066383

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $576,081 Well Total $1,196,650

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 6492’−8586’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TESTING THROUGH BRECO UNIT TO SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED THROUGH TEST UNIT TO SALES. 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 950 PSIG. CP 1750 PSIG. 48 BFPH.
RECOVERED 1236 BLW. 6104 BLWTR. 1044 MCFD RATE.





FLOWED 1048 MCF, 0 BC & 1254 BW IN 24 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. TP 1025 PSIG, CP 1925 PSIG.

05−21−2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $7,175 Daily Total $7,175

Cum Costs: Drilling $620,569 Completion $583,256 Well Total $1,203,825

MD 8,830 TVD 8,830 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8782.0 Perf : 6492’−8586’ PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TESTING THROUGH BRECO UNIT TO SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED THROUGH TEST UNIT TO SALES. 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 800 PSIG. CP 1550 PSIG. 43 BFPH.
RECOVERED 1080 BLW. 5024 BLWTR. 1300 MCFD RATE.





FLOWED 1141 MCF, 5 BC & 1236 BW IN 24 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. TP 890 PSIG, CP 1660 PSIG.
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STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT O FORM 8

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes)
DIVISlON OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML-3355

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

ia. TYPE OF WELL: OWELLL GWAESLL DRY OTHER
7. UNlTor CA AGREEMENT NAME

Chapita Wells
b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

EWL HORZ. EP-
TRY

EFSFVR
OTHER Chaptia Wells Unit 1400-32X

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-50766

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WLDCAT

1060 EAST HWY 40 VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-9145 Natural Buttes

4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE.
MERIDIAN:

AT SURFACE: 1185 FSIL &2631 FWL 39 988275 Lat 109.350739 Lon SESW 32 9S 23E S
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW: SAME

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTAL DEPTH: SAME Uintah UTAH

14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

1/27/2010 4/15/2010 5/18/2010 ABANDONED READYTOPRODUCE 2 5287' GL

18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 8,830 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 20 IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD
PLUGSET:

TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELL CORED? NO YES (Submit analysis)
CBL/CCL/VDL/GR WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submit report)

DIRECTlÒNAL SURVEY? NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#lft) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) STAGE MENTER C EONFSACKES VOLSUMRE
BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

12.25 9M5 J-55 36.0 0 2,401 1300 0

7.875 4.5 N-se 11.6 0 8,825 1670 1220

25. TUBING RECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2.375 7,363
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) . TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) 1NTERVAL(Top/Bot -MD) SlZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) Mesaverde 6,492 8,586 8,308 8,586 3/SPF open squeezed

(B) 8 034 8,236 2/SPF OPen Squeezed

(c) T,852 8,000 2/SPF Open Squeezed

(D) 7,648 7,825 2/SPF open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENTSQÙEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPE OF MATERIAL

8308-8586 34,923 GALS OF GELLED WATER & 104,600#20/40 SAND
8034-8236 48,477 GALS OF GELLED WATER & 152,000#20/40 SAND
7852-8000 40,015 GALS OF GELLED WATER & 121,300#20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DlRECTIONALSURVEY P ROD UCING
SUNDRY NOTlCE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICAT10N CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK) RECEIVED
JUN22 2018

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



31 INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD, METHOD:

5/18/2010 5/23/2010 24 RATES: 3 977 802 Flows

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVlTY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCT10N OlL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

24/64 700 1,415 RATES: 3 977 802 Producing

INTERVALB (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD, METHOD:

RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG, PRESS. CSG. PRESS. APl GRAVlTY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: 1NTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FlRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MOF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTlON OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCT10N OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE SlZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVlTY BTU- GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCT10N OlL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measu
edpDepth)

Mesaverde 6,492 8,586 Green River 1,226
Birds Nest Zone 1,550
Mahogany 2,111
Uteland Butte 4,268
Wasatch 4,371
Chapita Wells 4,975
Buck Canyon 5,662
Price River 6,467
Middle Price River 7,365

35. ADDITIONALREMARKS (Include plugging procedure)

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Mickenzie Gates TITLE Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE 6/18/2010

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
e completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well

• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

**ITEM24: Cement Top -Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



Chapita We/Is Unit 1400-32X-- ADDITIONAL REMARKS (CONTINUED):

26. PERFORATION RECORD
7357- 7522 2/spf
7185-7326 3/spf
6824-7126 2/spf
6492-6782 2/spf

27. ACID, FRACTURE TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
7648-7825 55,924 GALS GELLED WATER & 178,800# 20/40 SAND
7357- 7522 41,124 GALS GELLED WATER & 126,700# 20/40 SAND
7185-7326 33,979 GALS GELLED WATER & 100,100# 20/40 SAND
6824-7126 50,994 GALS GELLED WATER & 163,000# 20/40 ŠAND
6492-6782 51,796 GALS GELLED WATER & 166,600# 20/40 SAND

Perforated the Lower Price River from 8308'-09', 8315'-16', 8320'-21', 8330'-31',
8410'-11', 8413'-14', 8438'-39', 8476'-77', 8544'-45', 8555'-56', 8573'-74', 8585'-86'
wl 3 spf.

Perforated the Middle/Lower Price River from 8034'-35', 8051'-52', 8082'-83',
8101'-02', 8107'-08', 8117'-18', 8126'-2T, 8138'-39', 8166'-67', 8177'-78',
8187'-88', 8203'-04', 8231'-32', 8235'-36' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 7852'-53', 7864'-65', 7868'-69', 7888'-89',
7900'-01', 7907'-08', 7914'-15', 7919'-20', 7947'-48', 7951'-52', 7968'-69',
7973'-74', 7993'-94', 7999'-8000' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 7648'-49', 7654'-55', 7673'-74', 7681'-82',
7696'-97', 7701'-02', 7710'-11', 7719'-20', 7753'-54', 7766'-67', 7783'-84',
7801'-02', 7809'-10', 7824'-25' wl 2 spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 735T-58', 7363'-64', 7393'-94', 7400'-01',
7405'-06', 7430'-31', 7433'-34', 7456'-57', 7474'-75', 7497'-98', 7501'-02',
7506'-07', 7514'-15', 7521'-22' w/ spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7185'-86', 7197'-98', 7202'-03', 7215'-16',
7218'-19', 7238'-39', 7243'-44', 7265'-66', 7273'-74', 7281'-82', 7321'-22', 7325'-26'
wl 3 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 6824'-25', 6834'-35', 6859'-60', 6910'-11',
6918'-19', 6970'-71', 6983'-84', 7003'-04', 7014'-15', 7049'-50', 7078'-79',
7083'-84', 7118'-19', 7125'-26' wl 2 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 6492'-93', 6510'-11', 6529'-30', 653T-38',

6579'-80', 6604'-05', 6614'-15', 6623'-24', 6632'-33', 6676'-77', 6688'-89',
6698'-99', 6774'-75', 6781'-82' w/ 2



32. FORMATION (LOG) MARKERS
Lower Price River 8151
Sego



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: EOG Resources, Inc Operator Account Number: N 9550

Address: 1060 East Highway 40

city Vernal

state UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-9145

Well i

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-50766 CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1400-32X SESW 32 9S 23E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EffectiveDate

99999 /B gÔ 1/27/2010

Comments:

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-40311 CHAPITAWELLS UNIT 1402-33 SWNW 33 9S 23E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

99999 1/29/2010

Comments: MESAVERDE

Well 3

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-40312 CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 1403-33 SENW 33 9S 23E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

99999 2/2/2010 | $ /Ò
Comments: MESAVERDE

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Mickenzie Gates
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) Name (Please Print)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Signature

E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Operations Clerk 2/4/2010
RECEIVED ns. o..

(5/2000) FEBO8 2010
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



RECEIVED: Jun. 16, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML3355 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 1400-32X 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG RESOURCES, INC.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047507660000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1105 FSL 2631 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SESW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

6 /16 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Well Connect

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 CWU 1400-32X has been connected to Davies Road Facility on June 16,
2014. All wells producing at the Davies Road Facility are within PA#

A-Z, AA-BB, UTU63013BF.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Donna J Skinner 303 262-9467

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6 /16 /2014

July 16, 2014

Sundry Number: 52242 API Well Number: 43047507660000Sundry Number: 52242 API Well Number: 43047507660000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML3355

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 1400-32X

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOGRESOURCES,lNC. 43047507660000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

1105 FSL 2631 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SESW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

6/16/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: WellConnect

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

CWU 1400-32X has been connected to Davies Road Facility on June 16 ' Accepted by the
2014. All wells producing at the Davies Road Facility are within PA# Utah Division of

A-Z, AA-BB, UTU63013BF. Oil, Gas and Mining

FORiß¾ÇOW ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Donna J Skinner 303 262-9467 Sr. Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/16/2014

RECEIVED: Jun. 16,
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