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' FORM APPROVED
Form 3160-3 OMB NO. 1040-0136
(uly 1992) UNITED STATES SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE® Expires: February 28, 1995
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-0971
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN N/A
TYPE OF WORK 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
DRILL pEEPEN O WHITE RIVER UNIT
TYPE OF WELL 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.
o O sinete @ muLtipLE
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Contact: Jan Nelson
E-Mail: jan.nelson@questar.com

2. NAME OF OPERATOR
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.

9.AP1 NUMBER:

f3047- 40997

3. ADDRESS Telphone number
11002 E. 17500 SO. Vernal, Ut 84078 Phone 435-781-4031 Fax 435-781-4395

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT /.
1\6‘7
WHITE RIVER

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*)
At Surface 600' FSL 2321' FWL, SESW, SECTION 4, T8S, R22E
At proposed production zone 1500° FNL 1750' FEL, SWNE, SECTION 9, T8S, R22E

11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEY OR AREA

SEC. 4, T8S, R22E Mer SLB&M

14. DISTANCE IN MILES FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POSTOFFICE*
34 +/ - MILES SOUTH OF VERNAL, UTAH

12. COUNTY OR PARISH |13. STATE
Uintah uT

15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION TO NEAREST 16.NO.OF ACRES IN LEASE

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
{also to nearest drig,unit line if any)

600 '+ /-

160.00

17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

40

18.DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH

completed, applied for, on this lease, ft
8,097

20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
ESB000024

22. DATE WORK WILL START
ASAP

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.)
5167.9' GR

23. Estimated duration
40 Days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless

2. A Drilling Plan
3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is on National Forest System Lands,
the SUPOQ shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office).

ltem 20 above).
5. Operator certification.

authorized officer.

covered by an exisiting bond on file (see

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

Jh
SIGNED %,ﬁ/)/) (/((ng’%/ Name (printed/typed) Jan Nelson

DATE 05/22/2008

TITLE // Regulatory Affairs

(This space fVFederal or State office use}

PERMIT NO. 43’0 UY7-400 9 - APPROVAL DATE

Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds any legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon

N

CONDITIONS

APPROVAL, IF AN

BRADLEY G. HILL

¢ ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGER

APPROVED BY TITL

*See Instructions On Reverse Side
Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any depart

United States any false, fictitious or

or reg
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DATE OS/"Z?-—O?

ment or agency of the

" CONFIDENTIAL

Federal Approval of this
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CC 1938 Brass Cap 0.6 High, Mound of Stones
SB9E9'48°F 339.55' (Meas.)
SE COR. SEC. 32
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S 1500 FNL  1750° FEL. IT BEARS S36'2717°E »
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. -

Well location, WR #14G—4—8-22, located as
shown in the SE 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section 4, T8S,




ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Questar Exploration & Production Company
WR 14G-4-8-22

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil & Gas No. 1, and the
approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of its
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure
compliance.

1.

Formation Tops

The estimated top of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth, TVD Depth, MD
Green River 2,980’ 3,450°
Kick Off Point 5214’ 5214’
Green River (G1 Lime) 5,691’ 5,928’
TD 5,636’ 8,097’

Anticipated Depths of Oil, Gas, Water, and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top an bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas, or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered as follows:

Substance Formation Depth, TVD Depth, MD
Oil/Gas Green River (G1 Lime) 5,691’ - 5,636° 5,928’ — 8,097’

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling will
be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested
to determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted.
Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits Valley water right A36125 (which was
filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March
25, 1960). It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right
number filed before 1989 is not depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to
supply fresh water for drilling purposes. All water resulting from drilling operations
will be disposed of at Red Wash Central Battery Disposal site; SWSE, Section 27,
T78, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site; SWNW, Section 12, T8S, R21E.

Page 1 of 5



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Questar Exploration & Production Company
WR 14G-4-8-22

3. Operator’s Specification for Pressure Control Equipment

A. 3,000 psi double gate, 3,000 psi annular (schematic attached)
B. Function test daily.

C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.22 psi/ft or 1,500 psi, whichever
is greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not
exceed the internal yield of the casing.

D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to rated
working pressure if isolated by a test plug or to 50% of the internal yield
pressure of casing, whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet
the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2 for equipment
and testing requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 3M system and individual
components shall be operable as designed.

4. Casing Program
Hole Casing | Top, | Bottom, | Weight, Grade Thread | Condition
Size Size MD MD Lb/ft
17 2" 14” sfc 40° Steel Cond None Used
12 14” 9 5/8” sfc 480° 36.0 J-55 STC New
8347 7 sfc 5,989’ 26.0 L-80 LTC New
Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile

(minimum)

95/8" | 36.01b. J-55 STC | 2,020 psi 3,520 psi 394,000 Ib.

7" 26.0 Ib. L-80 LTC | 5,410 psi 7,240 psi 511,000 Ib.

The lateral portion of this wellbore will be cased with a slotted liner.

Hole Size | Casing Size | Top,MD Bottom, MD | Weight Grade
61/8” 41/2” 5,689 8,097° 11.6 J-55

Please refer to the attached wellbore diagram and re-entry procedure for further
details.

Page 2 of 5



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Questar Exploration & Production Company
WR 14G-4-8-22

S.

Cementing Program

20" Conductor:
Cement to surface with construction cement.

9-5/8" Surface Casing: sfc — 480' (MD)

Lead/Tail Slurry: 0° — 480°. 170 sks (310 cu ft) Rockies LT cement + 0.25 1b/sk
Kwik Seal + 0.125 lb/sk Poly-E-Flake. Slurry wt: 13.5 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.81 ft*/sk,
Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 100% excess.

7" Intermediate Casing: sfc - 5,989' (MD)

Lead/Tail Slurry: 3,989 — 5,989°. 305 sks (380 cu ft) 50/50 Poz Premium + 0.6%
Halad (R)-322 fluid loss + 2.0% Microbond M expander + 5% salt + 0.125 Ib/sk
Poly-E-Flake. Slurry wt: 14.35 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.24 ft*/sk, Slurry volume: 8-3/4"
hole + 25% excess.

4 1/2” Slotted Liner: 5,689’ — 8,097’ (MD)
No cement, dropped in open hole.

Auxilliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock — Yes

B. Float at the bit — No

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system — visually and/or PVT or Flow
Show

D. Fully opening safety valve on the rig floor — Yes

E. Rotating Head — Yes

If drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6” in diameter and extend at least 100’ from
the wellbore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when
drilling below 500°)

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of
the blooie lines for dust suppression.

Page 3 of 5



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Questar Exploration & Production Company
WR 14G-4-8-22

Drilling the surface hole with air:

A variance from 43 CFR 3160 Onshore Oil and Gas Order #2, Section III
requirements, subsection E Special Drilling Operations is requested for the specific
operation of drilling and setting surface casing on the subject well with a truck
mounted air rig. The variance from the following requirements of Order #2 is
requested because surface casing depth for this well is less than 500 feet and high
pressures are not expected.

a. Properly lubricated and maintained rotating head. A diverter system in

place of a rotating head. The diverter system forces the air and cutting returns
to the reserve pit and is used to drill the surface casing.

. Blooie line discharge 100’ from well bore and securely anchored. The

blooie line discharge for this operation will be located 50 to 70 feet from the
wellhead. This reduced length is necessary due to the smaller location size to
minimize surface disturbance.

Automatic ignitor or continuous pilot light on the blooie line. A diffuser
will be used rather than an automatic pilot/ignitor. Water is injected into the
compressed air and eliminates the need for the pilot light and the need for dust
suppression equipment.

. Compressors located in the opposite direction from the blooie line a

minimum of 100 feet from the well bore. Compressors located 50 feet on
the opposite side of the well bore from the blooie line and is equipped with a
1) emergency kill switch on the driller’s console, 2) pressure relief valve on
the compressor, 3) spark arrestors on the motors.

Drilling of the laterals will be done with fresh water NaCl based mud systems
consisting primarily of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash,
polymers, and NaCl. No chromates will be used. It is not intended to use oil in the
mud, however, in the event it is used the concentration will be less than 4% by
volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 10.0 ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow show will be used upon exit of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used upon exit of surface casing to TD.

7. Testing, Logging, and Coring Program

A.

B.

Cores — None Anticipated

DST — None Anticipated

Page 4 of 5



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Questar Exploration & Production Company

WR 14G-4-8-22
C. Logging:
1. Mud logging from casing exit to TD
ii. MWD-GR will be utilized during drilling operations to aid in landing
the curve and maintaining the lateral within the desired zone.
D. Formation and completion interval: H4a Lime interval, final determination of

completion will be made by analysis of mud logging data. Stimulation:
stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest encountered.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H,S has been
encountered or is known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the
general area. Maximum anticipated bottom-hole pressure equals approximately 2,800
psi. Maximum anticipated bottom hole temperature is approximately 120°F.

Page 5 of 5



QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
Surface 600’ FSL 2321' FWL, SESW, SEC. 4, T8S, R22E
BHL 1500' FNL 1750' FEL, SEC. 9, T8S, R22E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-0971

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI — POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

An onsite inspection was conducted for the WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 on April 1, 2008. Weather conditions
were cold at the time of the onsite. In attendance at the inspection were the following individauls:

Holly Villa Bureau of Land Management

Amy Torres Bureau of Land Management

Don Alired Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying
Raymond Pallesen Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
Jan Nelson Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
1. Existing Roads:

The proposed well site is approximately 34 miles South of Vernal, Utah.
Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 — mile radius.

There will be no improvements made to existing road.

Planned Access Roads:

Please see Questar Exploration & Production Company Standard Practices for Green River
Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hiils, White River, Glen Bench
and undesignated fields in Township 08 South, Ranges 22 East.

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 — Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.
Location of Existing & Proposed Facilities:

Please see Questar Exploration & Production Company Standard Practices for Green River
Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench
and undesignated fields in Township 08 South, Ranges 22 East.

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.

Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please see Questar Exploration & Production Company Standard Practices for Green River
Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench
and undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.



10.

Water for drilling purposes would be obtained from Wonsits Valley Water Right # A 36125 (which
was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash Water Right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960).
It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before 1989 is
not depleting to the Upper Colorado River System.

Source of Construction Materials:

Please see Questar Exploration & Production Company Standard Practices for Green River
Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench
and undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Please see Questar Exploration & Production Company Standard Practices for Green River
Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench
and undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Ancillary Facilities:

Please see Questar Exploration & Production Company Standard Practices for Green River
Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench
and undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Product will be tanked and hauled to delivery site.

Facilities will be painted Carlsbad Canyon

Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills
and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailer parking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads.
A felt pit liner will be required if bedrock is encountered.

Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please see Questar Exploration & Production Company Standard Practices for Green River
Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench
and undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Interim Reclamation
Please see attached Interim Reclamation plan.

Once the well is put onto production, QEP will reclaim as much of the well pad as possible that will allow
for operations to continue in a safe and reasonable manner. Reseeding will be done in the spring or fall
of every year to allow winter precipitation to aid in the succuss of reclamation.
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12.

Seed Mix:

Interim Reclamation:

6 Ibs Hycrest Crested Wheatgrass

6 Ibs Needle & Threadgrass

Final Reclamation:

Seed Mix # 3 3 Ibs. Shadscale, 3 Ibs. Indian Rice Grass, 3 Ibs. Needle & Threadgrass
4 Ibs. Hycrest Crested Wheat

Surface Ownership:
Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East

Vernal, Utah 84078

(435) 781-4400

Other Information

A Class lll archaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology

Consultants. A copy of this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by
Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended
for this location.

A class lll paleontological survey was conducted by Intermountain Paleo Consuiting. A copy of

this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by Stephen D. Sandau.

The inspection resulted in the location of no fossil resources. However, if vertebrate fossil(s) are found
during construction a paleontologist should be immediately notified. QEP will provide paleo monitor if needed.

There is a Burrowing Owl Stipulation from March 1 thru August 15. No construction or drilling will
commence during this period unless otherwise determined by a wildlife biologist that the site is inactive.

There is a Red Tailed Hawk Stipulation from March 15 thru August 15. No construction or drilling will
commence during this period unless otherwise determined by a wildlife biologist that the site is inactive.
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Lessee’s or Operator's Representative:

Jan Nelson
Red Wash Rep.

Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
11002 East 17500 South
Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4331

Certification:

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved
plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

Questar Explor. & Prod. Co. will be fully responsible for the actions of their subcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drill will be furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all
construction and drilling operations.

| hereby certify that |, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access route; that | am familiar with the conditions which currently
exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by Questar Explor. & Prod. Co. it's contractors and subcontractors
in conformity with this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. This
statement is subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

Qéyﬁ Ufﬁ%/ Sen 5/22/2008

Jan Nelson Date
Red Wash Representative
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Additional Operator Remarks

Questar Exploration & Production Company proposes to drill a horizontal well to test the
Green River formation. If productive, casing will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well
will be plugged and abandoned as per BLM and State of Utah requirements"

See Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 1

Please see Questar Exploration & Production Company Standard Practices for Green River
Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Benct
and undesignated fields in Township 08 South, Ranges 22East.

Please be advised that Questar Exploration & Production Company agrees to be responsible
under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease
lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No.ESB000024. The principal is Questar
Exploration & Production Company via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR 3104.2.



QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION

WR 14G-4-8-22
New Horizontal Well
Summarized Procedure

MIRU air rig.

Drill 12 ¥4” surface hole to 480°+.

Run 9 5/8”, 36#, J-55, STC casing and cement to surface.

RD air rig, move off location.

MIRU drilling rig.

NU rig’s 3,000 WP rated BOP. Test BOP’s and surface casing.

PU straight hole BHA, drill out surface casing and 10’ of new formation, run FIT.
Drill 8 3%’ hole to 5,000°.

TOOH, PU directional BHA, TIH.

Drill to 5,214°, kick off and drill well at a 143.54° azimuth with 12°/100° build
rates to land in G1 Lime formation at a TVD of +/- 5,692°, 5,977° MD.

11. Drill in zone to 5,989° MD. TOOH, LDDP.

12. PU and run 77, 26#, L-80, LTC casing to 5,989°, cement casing.

13. PU 3 %2” DP, directional BHA, TTH.

14. Drill +/- 2,110’ of lateral in G1 Lime.

a. Mud system to be a KCI weighted water based mud, weights are expected to

A S A o

,_.
e

be in the 9.0 — 10.0 ppg range.
15. Circulate and condition hole, TOOH, LD 2,400’ DP.
a. PU 2,110’ of 4-1/2” slotted liner, 300 of blank liner and liner dropping tool.
b. RIH w/ liner and dropping tool, drop liner at 5,689.
c. LDDP.
16.  RU wireline, RIH and set RBP @ +/- 4,500’ to isolate lateral.
17. NDBOP’s.
18. RDMO.
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WR 14G-4-8-22
9 5/8", 36#, J-55 ' 4—-—-—- 12 1/4" hole
csg set @ 480’ :
8 3/4" hole —»
< 7", 26#, L-80 csg

. o '
Build Rate 12°/100 6 1/8" hole

Kickoff Point 5,214’

.................................................................

................................................................

7", 26#, L-80 csg 4-1/2", 11.6#,
set at 5,989 J-55 slotted liner
5,689' - 8,097



QUESTAR

Questar Exploration & Production
Uintah Co., UT |
Sec.4-T8S-R22E

WR 14G-4-8-22

Wellbore #1

Plan: Plan #1

Pathfinder Planning Report

13 :November, 2007

PATHFINDER
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QUESTAZR

Pathfinder Energy Services
Planning Report

PATHFINDER

“ENERGY SERVICES
Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Go-ordinate Reference: ‘Well WR 14G-4-8-22 :
Company: Questar Exploration & Production TVD Reference: - WELL (copy) @ 5185.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: Uintah Co., UT MD Reference: - WELL (copy) @ 5185.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Sec.4-T8S-R22E North Reference: True
Well: WR 14G4-8-22 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 '
Design: Plan #1
Project Uintah Co., UT
Map System: US State Plane 1983 System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: North American Datum 1983
Map Zone: Utah Central Zone
Site .-Sec.4-T8S-R22E
Site Position: Northing: 7.228,505.741 Latitude: 40° 8 45.769 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,214,150.03ft Longitude: 109° 26' 50.669 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 131 °
well WR 14G-4-8-22 o
Well Position +N/-S 0.0 ft Northing: 7,228,505.74 ft Latitude: 40° 8'45.769 N
+El-W 0.0ft Easting: 2,214,150.03 ft Longitude: 109° 26’ 50.669 W
Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 5,174.01t
Wellbore Wellbore #1
Magnetics -Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength
) ) (nT)
IGRF200510 11/13/2007 11.52 66.10 52,793
Design Plan #1
Audit Notes:
Version: Phase: PROTOTYPE Tie On Depth: 0.0
Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +N/-S +EI-W Direction
() (L) m )
5,636.2 0.0 0.0 143.54
Plan Sections
. Measured Vertical . Dogleg Build Turn .
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +N/-S +EI-W Rate Rate Rate TFO
() ©) ) ) () (ft) (°100ft) (°/100ft) (°/100ft) ©) Target
0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52144 O.QO 0.00 52144 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5976.9 91.50 143.54 5,691.7 -394.1 291.2 12.00 12.00 0.00 143.54
8,097.4 91.50 143.54 5,636.2 -2,098.9 1,550.9 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 PBHL WR 14G4-8-2:

11/13/2007 2:55:36PM
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QUESTAZR

Pathfinder Energy Services
Planning Report

PATHFINDER

'ENERGY SERVICES
Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well WR 14G-4-8-22
Company: . Questar Exploration & Production TVD Reference: WELL (copy) @ 5185.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: “Uintah Co., UT .. MD Reference: VVELL (copy) @ 5185.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Sec.4-T8S-R22E . MNorth Reference: True
Well: WR 14G4-8-22 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Plan #1
Planned Survey
Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth’ +N/-S +EW Section Rate Rate Rate
" ) (¥] {f w (1) (ft) (°M00ft) - (°MOOft) " (°100ft)
KOP / Start Build 12,00°
52144 0.00 0.00 5,214.4 00 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
5225.0 1.27 143.54 5,225.0 -0.1 0.1 0.1 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,250.0 427 143.54 5,250.0 -1.1 08 13 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,275.0 7.27 143.54 52748 3.1 23 3.8 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,300.0 10.27 143.54 5,299.5 6.2 45 7.7 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,325.0 13.27 143.54 5,324.0 -10.3 76 128 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,350.0 16.27 143.54 5,348.2 -15.4 11.4 191 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,375.0 19.27 143.54 53720 215 159 26.8 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,400.0 2227 143.54 5,395.4 -28.6 212 35.6 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,425.0 25.27 143.54 54182 -36.8 27.2 45.7 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,450.0 28.27 143.54 5,440.6 -45.8 338 57.0 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,475.0 31.27 143.54 5,462.3 -55.8 412 69.4 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,500.0 34.27 143.54 5,483.3 -66.7 493 829 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,525.0 37.27 143.54 5,503.6 -78.4 579 975 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,550.0 40.27 143.54 5,523.0 -91.0 67.3 1132 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,575.0 43.27 143.54 5,541.7 -104.4 771 129.8 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,600.0 46.27 143.54 5,550.4 -118.6 87.6 1474 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,625.0 49.27 143.54 5,576.2 -133.5 98.6 1659 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,650.0 5227 143.54 5,592.0 -149.0 110.1 1853 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,675.0 55.27 143.54 5,606.8 -165.2 122.1 2055 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,700.0 58.27 143.54 5,620.5 -182.1 1345 226.4 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,725.0 61.27 143.54 5,633.1 -199.4 1474 248.0 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,750.0 64.27 143.54 5,644.5 2173 160.6 270.2 12.00 12.00 0.00
57750 67.27 143.54 5,654.8 2356 1741 293.0 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,800.0 70.27 143.54 5,663.8 -254.4 188.0 316.3 12.00- - 12.00 0.00
5,825.0 73.27 143.54 5671.7 -273.5 202.1 340.0 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,850.0 76.27 143.54 5,678.2 2929 216.4 364.2 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,875.0 79.27 143.54 5,683.5 3125 2309 388.6 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,900.0 82.27 143.54 5,687.5 -3324 2456 4133 12.00 12.00 0.00
§,925.0 85.27 143.54 5,690.2 -352.4 260.4 4381 12.00 12.00 0.00
G1 Lime Top Porosity ) ’ ) :
5927.7 85.60 143.54 5,690.5 -354.5 262.0 440.8 12.00 12.00 0:00
5,950.0 88.27 143.54 56916 -372.4 275.2 463.1 12.00 12.00 0.00
Start 2120.5 hold at 5976.9 MD )
5976.9 91.50 143.54 5,691.7 -394.1 291.2 490.0 12.00 12.00 0.00
7" Casing
5,088.5 91.50 143.54 5,691.4 -403.4 2981 501.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,000.0 91.50 143.54 5,691.1 -412.6 304.9 5131 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,100.0 91.50 143.54 5,688.5 -493.0 364.3 613.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,200.0 91.50 143.54 5,685.9 5734 423.7 7130 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,300.0 91.50 143.54 5,683.2 -653.8 483.1 813.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,400.0 91.50 143.54 5,680.6 -734.2 5425 912.9 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,500.0 91.50 143.54 5,678.0 8146 601.9 1,012.9 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,600.0 9150 143.54 5,675.4 -895.0 661.3 1,112.8 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,700.0 91.50 143.54 5,672.8 -975.4 720.7 1,212.8 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,800.0 91.50 143.54 5,670.2 -1,055.8 780.1 1,312.8 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,900.0 91.50 143.54 5,667.5 -1,136.2 839.5 1,412.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,000.0 91.50 143.54 5,664.9 -1,216.6 898.9 15127 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,100.0 91.50 143.54 5,662.3 -1,297.0 958.4 1,612.7 0.00 0.00 0.00.
7,200.0 91.50 143.54 5,659.7 -1,377.4 1,017.8 1,71286 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,300.0 91.50 143.54 5,657.1 -1,457.8 1,077.2 1,8126 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,400.0 91.50 143.54 5,654.4 -1,638.2 1,136.6 19126 0.00 0.00 0.00

11/13/2007 2:55:36PM
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QUESTZR

Pathfinder Energy Services

Planning Report

PATHFINDER

EN ERGY SERVIC ES
Database: - EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: ~ Well WR 14G-4-8-22
Company:. Questar Exploration & Production TVD Reference: WELL (copy) @ 5185.0ft (Criginal Well Elev)
Project: Uintah Co., UT MD Reference: WELL (copy) @ 5185.0ft (Originai Well Elev)
Site: Sec.4-T8S-R22E North Reference: True
Well: WR 14G4-8-22 Survey Calculation Method:  Minimum Curvature -
Wellbore: Wellbore #1 ) i
Design: Plan #1
Planned Survey
Measured ) Vertical Vertical Dogleg Buitd Turn
Depth fnclination Azimuth Depth +N/-S +ELW Section Rate Rate Rate
(v © ©) () ) 0 () (*1ooft) (°1ooR) (°Moof)
7,500.0 91.50 143.54 5,651.8 -1,618.6 1,196.0 2,012.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,600.0 91.50 143.54 5,649.2 -1,699.0 1,2554 2,112.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,700.0 91.50 143.54 5,646.6 -1,779.4 1,314.8 2,212.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,800.0 91.50 143.54 5,644.0 -1,859.8 1,3742 2,312.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,900.0 91.50 143.54 5,641.4 -1,940.2 1,433.6 2,412.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,000.0 91.50 143.54 5,638.7 -2,020.6 1,493.0 2,512.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
TD at 8097.4 - PBHL WR 14G-4-8-22 ’
8,097.4 91.50 143.54 5,636.2 -2,098.9 1,550.9 2,609.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
Targets .
Target Name o
- hit/miss target Dip Angle  Dip Dir. TVD +N/-8 +El-W Northing Easting
- Shape © © ) (ft) (ft) () Latitude Longitude
PBHL WR 14G4-8-22 0.00 0.00 - 5,636:2 -2,098.9 1,550.9 7,226,442.98 2,215,748.69 40° 8 25,025 N 109° 26' 30.698 W
- plan hits target ’
- Point
Casing Points .
Measured Vertical Casing Hole
Depth Depth Diameter Diameter
(ft) ) Name ¢) Ny
5,988.5 5,691.4 7" Casing 7 8-3/4
Formations
Measured Vertical Dip
Depth Depth Dip Direction
0] () Name Lithology ©) ©)
5,927.7 5,702.0 G1 Lime Top Porosity -1.50 143.54
5,706.0 G1 Lime Bottom Porosity -1.50 143.54
Plan Annotations
Measured Vertical Local Coordinates
Depth Depth +N/-S +E/-W )
n () - (ft) (ft) Comment =
5,214.4 52144 0.0 0.0 KOP / Start Build 12.00°
5,976.9 5,691.7 -394.1 291.2 Start 2120.5 hold at 5976.9 MD
8,097.4 5,636.2 -2,098.9 1,550.9 TD at 8097.4
11/13/2007 2:55:36PM Page 4 COMPASS 2003.16 Build 42



Company: - Questar Exploration & Production B
Field: Uintah Co., UT
% Location: Sec.4-T8S-R22E
”Esr‘ R Well: WR 14G-4-8-22 TN
: - Wellbore #1 ENERGY SERVICES ]
Plan: Plan #1 (WR 14G-4-8-22/\Wellbore #1) I R
SECTION DETAILS 1000—
Sec MD I Azl ™D NI'S  +EFW DL TF Vs Target ] e A AT S e nang)
ne + +EM eg ace ec arge - PG y (Sec.4-T )
1 00  0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 f SeC 4—T8$-R22E PBHL: 1500° FNL & 1750' FEL
2 62144 . 0.00 0.00 . 5214.4 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 . - = - PR L (Sec.9-T8S-R22E)
3 59769 9150 14354 = 56917 3841 = 291.2 1200  143.54 490.0 500—
4 8097.4 91.50 14354 . 56362 - -2098.9 1550.9 0.00 0.00 - 2609.7  PBHL WR 14G-4-8-22 i
WELL DETAILS: WR 14G-4-8-22 T M. . Azimuths to True North ] A
Magnetic North; 11.52° 0—] Start Build 1200 - _ _ _
Ground Level:  §174.0 _
+NI-S  +EMW Northing Easting Latittude Longitude - Slot strengtl‘:lfggt;gg 5‘;‘? = |
0.0 0.0 . 722850574  2214150.03 40°8'45.769 N 109° 26' 50.669 W B e 66,105 S | Sart 21208 hold st SO78SMD_ &T. Casing
Date: 11/13/2007 N
WELLBORE TARGET DETAILS Model: IGRF200510|| & -500— Y PEHL WR 1G-4422
o [
Name TVD +NI-§ +E/W Shape = . ! ‘
PBHL WR 14G-4-8-22 5636.2 .-2098.9 1550.9 - Point = 1
7 ]
=+-1000—
= ]
FORMATION TOP DETAILS § :
TVDPath MD% Formation //\ ,\_I\ _ WR 14(5-4@—22/‘J‘/ei6bqre#‘z
G4 Lime Bottom Porosity — L ™S =-1500— e
5600.5  5927.7 G Lime Top Porosity 0 Bl ~ s ] -~
' o ] e
1000 w ] L/
0] ~2000—
» 1
o2 ] ora T B
-2500— TD at-8097.4
5000 ]
o ]
100” lllllllllllll]llllllllllIlllllllllllllll
-1500 -1000 -500 0 500 1000 1500 2000 2500
West(-)/East(+) (1000 ft/in)
] z ANNOTATIONS
: 1 Start Build 12.00 TVD MD Annotation
5000— ! -7 5214.4- 5214.4 KOP/ Start Build 12.00°
i j e 5691.7 5976.9 Start2120.5 hold at 5976.9-MD
- el 6636.2° 8097.4 TD at8097.4
= 7] w7
S _ ”
85250—
el ] \ Start 2120.5 hold at 5976.9 MD PBHLWR 14G-4-8-22 TD at 8097.4
£ - -
a E -7 "\ e
ba] - \\ =7 \ -7
—=5500— G1 Lime Top Porosity N\, - \ e
8 _ e ke \\ Prs
b= - e - 3\ g
o . - i @ @ @ ——
$ 1 _ mos |
2 =3
=5750—~_
— G1 Lim\ e Bottom Porosity
—IIIII|l|IIIIIIIIIIIIII]lllllllllIII Illllllllllllllllll[llllllllllll‘llIlllllllllllllllllIllllll
-1250 -1000 =750 -500 -250 0 250 500 750 1000 1250 1500 1750 2000 2250 2500 2750 3000 3250 3500 3750
Vertical Section at 143.54° (500 ft/in)




QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
WR #14G-4-8-22

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

= B Y

'W FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHWESTERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying rocationN pHotos [10]11|07| proTO

S 85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 MONTH| DAY | YEAR
- Since 1964 - 435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com TAKEN BY: D.A. | DRAWNBY: Z.L. |REVISED: 00-00-00




QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

LOCATION LAYOUT FOR
WR #14G—4-8-22
SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
—600° FSL 2321 FWL

/ Area
|

| FIGURE #1]

Reclaimed

Fill Slope

ressre ATs | |
(15" Dosp) - B
. -f. 73.5' o’

. \C-206""",
Y~ etmpn) . L —
- c-3.2°
£ 71.1°

Proposed Access

NOTES: Road

Elev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Stake = 5171.2°

c-29° \
& 7a.a'f6:|] 7T ropsoil StockPIE )
r s Sta. 3+50
/ 7
SCALE: 1” = 50’ — ’
DATE: 10—12—07 5 0‘& Round Corner
: £l 68.7 Needed
Drawn By: S.L. as Neede S
S
- Ay
n N
s Approx. ~ s
7 Top of =
NOTE: Cut Slope Z
Flare Pit is to be located 2
a min. of 100° from the : -
Y Well Head. AT I
(é{'t | Topsoll, PIPE_TUBS
o g PIPE RACKS \
CAAREAT . T N S
R =87 ' ' cI—JJ" |
o N G &5
A | e _l e . |
. ’f] I o 48| 1 150 Sta. 1+75
T ’ - 70’ ﬂEQ |"_'|
a. 747 | o o TOLET
¢-21.8 [ ¥ c-56 =]
(im. 2.1 _ — & 75 T
R i =
- ‘3‘3% |3 A |e
LR é [ o \ 2 PUNPJHous ~ COPERESFOR
.‘\.‘ i l(: - '5' / = B%ER
2 §(g. =
LRS-
“§ ‘\, : " u
Total Pit Capacity
W/2' of Freeboard - /
= 12,240 Bbls. + ¢
Total Pit Volume ?r
= 3210 Cu. Yos. ]

lﬁ] F~7.2

£, 60.7°

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 Kast * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789—1017

FINISHED GRADE ELEV. AT LOC. STAKE =5167.9°,




@

X—Section

©
~
Il
. Scale
s

1” = 50°
DATE: 10-12-07
Drawn By: S.L.

Preconstruction
Grade

 e—

—_—

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR

| FICURE #2]

SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
600" FSL 2321" FWL

WR #14G—4—-8-22

| 48’ 150°
Finished Grade
—_— ourT
STA.
48’ 150’ |
Location Stake Slope = 1 1/2:1
‘ (Tp-)

STA. 1+75
150° |
150’ |
L ALL —
= |||t TN N
APPROXIMATE YARDAGES e S
' STA. 0+00 — —
CuT
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 7,770 Cu. Yds. NOTE=.
Remaining Location = 8070 Cu. Yds. Topsoil should not be * NOTE:
Stripped Below Finished FILL QUANTITY INCLUDES
TOTAL CUT 9.840 CU.YDS. Grade on Substructure Area. 5% FOR COMPACTION
FILL = 6,460 CU.YDS. APPROXIMATE ACREAGES

Excess Material

Topsoil & Pit Backfill
(1/2 Pit Vol.)

EXCESS UNBALANCE

(After Interim Rehabilitation)

3,380 Cu. Yds.
3,380 Cu. Yds.

0 Cu. Yds.

WELL SITE DISTURBANCE = £2.108 ACRES
ACCESS ROAD DISTURBANCE = +1.702 ACRES
PIPELINE DISTURBANCE = :+1.443 ACRES

TOTAL = £5.253 ACRES

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
856 So. 200 Kast * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789—1017




® —

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

| FIGURE #3]

INTERIM RECLAMATION PLAN FOR
WR #14G—4—8—22
SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
600" FSL 2321° FWL

r
SCALE: 1 = 50
DATE: 10—-12-07
Drawn By: S.L.

L{/%As—u.#

@

{00

Production Tanks

A\

Access
Road

/] TR RecLAMATION UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. 200 Kast * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (436) 7891017
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LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
(© PROPOSED LOCATION N WR #14G-4-8-22

SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
600' FSL 2321’ FWL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGRAPHIC|1( 11107
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 MAP monTal pay | YEAR A
IS SCALE: 1:100,000§ DRAWN BY: Z.L. JREVISED: 00-00-00] [ Re3 e}

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
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LEGEND:

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

EXISTING ROAD
— . e e e et e e e e e e PROPOSED ACCESS

WR #14G-4-8-22
SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
600' FSL 2321’ FWL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying

Ii ,I 85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

ToPOGRAPHIC[IO[11[07

MAP MONTH| DAY | YEAR

SCALE: 1"=2000' DRAWN BY: Z.L. |REVISED: 00-00-00f
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LEGEND.

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

2 DISPOSAL WELLS &/ WATER WELLS N WR #14G-4-8-22
@ PRODUCING WELLS -@- ABANDONED WELLS SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
@ SHUT IN WELLS -@- TEMPORARILY ABANDONED 600' FSL 2321° FWL

10{11{07 C
8S South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 Nl A P MONTH| DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE: 1"=2000'] DRAWN BY: Z.L. JREVISED: 00-00-00| B ey Te’

l ] Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGRAPHIC
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508

APPROXIMATE TOTAL PIPELINE DlSTANCE 2 095 +/—

LEGEND:

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD
— EXISTING PIPELINE
PROPOSED PIPELINE

WR #14G-4-8-22
SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
600' FSL 2321’ FWL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying

85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

TOPOGRAPHIC|10l11107
MAP MoNTH| DAY | YEAR D
SCALE: 1"=1000'| DRAWN BY: Z.L. |REVISED: 00-00-00| BEY8) 6’
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DRILLING PROGRAM

SCHEMATIC DIAGRAM OF 3,000 PSI BOP STACK
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WORKSHEET

Q

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 05/27/2008

WELL NAME: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
OPERATOR : QUESTAR EXPLORATION & ( N5085 )
CONTACT : JAN NELSON
PROPOSED LOCATION:
SESW 04 080S 220E
SURFACE: 0600 FSL 2321 FWL
BOTTOM: 1500 FNL 1750 FEL §1661
COUNTY: UINTAH
LATITUDE: 40.14632 LONGITUDE: -109.4461
UTM SURF EASTINGS: 632362 NORTHINGS: 4444944
FIELD NAME: WHITE RIVER ( 705 )
LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

UTU-0971
1l - Federal

LEASE NUMBER:
SURFACE OWNER:

API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-40097

PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4031

INSPECT LOCATIN BY: / /
Tech Review Initials Date
Engineering

Geology

Surface

PROPOSED FORMATION: GRRV
COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED:

u///Plat

/~ Bond: Fed[1l] Ind[] Sta[] Feel]
(No. ESB000024 )

N

LOCATION AND SITING:

_ R649-2-3. q%ﬁl{or{QxYL+ﬁl:>

Unit: WHITE RIVER

Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General
AJ 0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
L//'Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No. 49-2153 )
i ce Y/N v/"Drilling Unit
A RD Review -
(Date: ( ) ) Board Cause No: /3'2_/
' Eff Date: FEVEY,
A#*  Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting: N drs E924 y e
[—__ Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill
COMMENTS :
STIPULATIONS: i - §:1u,14i:22@%ﬁ7wq(/)
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su 2w-s822 sl GB m{:—s 22 :
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WRU §
ou GB
STIRRUP wvu 7 hiooi 6W-4-8-22 et ¢
WYU 8¢ U7G-5-822 it " : OG-
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® ou GB- :
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<
su
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SU 1OW-5822 i £k GB el DN
STIRRUP UNIT 10G-5-8-22 wiaT nw-4-422 - mu 33
u &
9G-5-822 . WHITE RIVER UNIT
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Wells Status
CAUSE: 138-1 / 8-13-1969 ~ GAS INJECTION
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Field Status Unilé{t;% S AORY < PLUGGED & ABANDONED
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3160
(UT-922)
May 29, 2008
Memorandum
To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District
From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2008 Plan of Development White River Unit,
Uintah County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of 0il, Gas and
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management, the following well is planned for calendar year 2008
as a horizontal completion within the White River Unit, Uintah
County, Utah.

APl # WELL NAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ Green River)

43-047-40097 WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Sec 4 T08S R22E 0600 FSL 2321 FWL
BHL Sec 9 T08S R22E 1500 FNL 1750 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the well at this time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bce: File - White River Unit
Division of 0il Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron

MCoulthard:mc:5-29-08
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Executive Director

S

4

Division of Qil, Gas and Mining
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor JOHN R. BAZA

Division Director
GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

May 29, 2008

Questar Exploration & Production Company
11002 E 17500 S

Vermal, UT 84078

Re: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Well, Surface Location 600' FSL. 2321' FWL, SE SW. Sec. 4

T. 8 South, R. 22 East, Bottom Location 1500' FNL, 1750' FEL. SW NE. Sec. 9.
T. 8 South, R. 22 East, Uintah County, Utah

[}

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah

Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous

operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-40097.

Sincerely,
Gil Hunt
. Associate Director
pab
Enclosures
cc: Uintah County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal Office

UTAH
A
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 + facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS & MINING



Operator: Questar Exploration & Production Company

Well Name & Number WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

API Number: 43-047-40097

Lease: UTU-0971

Surface Location: _SE SW Sec. 4 T. _8 South R. _22 East

Bottom Location: _SW NE Sec._ 9 _ T. _8 South R. _22 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
. Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
o Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281  (801) 733-0983 home

[S8)

. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit
a complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days
following completion of the well.



RECEIVED

Form 3160-3 MA Y

{auly 1982) UNITED STATES
BLM

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED

OMB NO. 1040-0136
Expires: February 28, 1995

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

UTU-8974 ﬂaﬁ N d

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
' N/A

TYPE OF WORK
DRILL DEEPEN O
oL CONFIDENTIAL
O O sineLe & muLTiPLE
OIL WELL GASWELL  OTHER ZONE ZONE

7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
WHITE RIVER UNIT

8. FARM OR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.

Contact: Jan Nelson
E-Mail: jan.nelson@questar.com

2. NAME OF OPERATOR
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.

WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
9.API NUMBER:

2 o471 40077

3. ADDRESS Telphone number )
11002 E. 17500 SO. Vernal, Ut 84078 Phone 435-781-4031 Fax 435-781-4395

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
WHITE RIVER

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*)
At Surface 600" FSL 2321' FWL, SESW, SECTION 4, T8S, R22E
At proposed production zone 1500' FNL 1750° FEL, SWNE, SECTION 9, T8S, R22E

11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEY OR AREA

SEC. 4, T8S, R22E Mer SLB&M

14. DISTANCE IN MILES FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POSTOFFICE*
34 + /- MILES SOUTH OF VERNAL, UTAH

12. COUNTY OR PARISH |13. STATE
Uintah Ut

15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION TO NEAREST 16.NO.OF ACRES IN LEASE

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
{(also to nearest drig,unit line if any)

600"+ -

160.00

17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

40

18.DIZPANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH

completed, applied for, on this lease, ft
8,097

20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
ESB000024

22. DATE WORK WILL START
ASAP

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.)
5167.9' GR

23. Estimated duration
40 Days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
2. A Drilling Plan

3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is on National Forest System Lands, .

the SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office).
P
e

a

Item 20 above).
5. Operator certification.

authorized officer.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an exisiting bond on file (see

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

DATE  05/22/2008

[ ]
SIGNED\\_L/'ﬂ[f\ ) \’@ ( ,Lﬁfj”“& Name (printedityped) Jan Nelson

N
TITLE { egulatory Affairs

{This space lorFedul or State office use) S T S o

PERMIT NO. APPROVAL DATE
Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds any legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY:
Assistant Field Manager
APPROVED BY TITLE Lands & Mineral Resources DATE  &-¢-2008

*See Instructions On Reverse Side

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false, fictiti or

NOS 324209 -
AFMSS# 08P0T00A

as to any mater within its jurisdiction

CONEIDENTIAL

AUG 1 22008
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING



#

" 170 South 500 East

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
VERNAL, UT 84078

(435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: Questar Exp. & Prod,, Inc. Location: SESW, Sec 4, T8S, R22E

Well No: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Lease No: UTU-02510A

API No: 43-047-40097 Agreement: White River Unit
Title Name Office Phone Number  Cell Phone Number
Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker (435) 781-4490 (435) 828-4470
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee (435) 781-4432 (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer: James Ashley (435) 781-4470 (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer: Ryan Angus (435) 781-4430 (435) 828-7368
Supervisory Petroleum Technician:  Jamie Sparger (435) 781-4502 (435) 828-3913
Supervisory NRS: Karl Wright (435) 781-4484 (435) 828-7381
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Holly Villa (435) 781-4404 (435) 828-3544
NRS/Enviro Scientist: James Hereford (435) 781-3412
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Chuck Macdonald (435) 781-4441 (435) 828-7481
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Dan Emmett (435) 781-3414

NRS/Enviro Scientist: Paul Percival (435) 781-4493
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Michael Cutler (435) 781-3401 (435) 828-3546
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Anna Figueroa (435) 781-3407 (435) 828-3548
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Verlyn Pindell (435) 781-3402 (435) 828-3547
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Darren Williams (435) 781-4447 (435) 828-4029

NRS/Enviro Scientist:

Nathan Packer

(435) 781-3405

(435) 828-3545

Fax: (435) 781-3420

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with the applicable
laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill including Surface and Downhole
Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of the
approved APD must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion operations. This permit is approved
for a two (2) year period, or until lease expiration, whichever occurs first. An additional extension, up to two (2)
years, may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and
access roads.
Prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Location Construction -
(Notify Environmental Scientist)
Location Completion -
(Notify Environmental Scientist)

Spud Notice - | Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notify Petroleum Engineer)
Casing String & Cementing - | Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and cementing

all casing strings.
Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.

(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.)
BOP & Related Equipment Tests -
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.)
First Production Notice -
(Notify Petroleum Engineer)

Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
production resumes after well has been off production for more
than ninety (90) days.
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Well Number/Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

e If there is an active Gilsonite mining operation within 2 miles of the well location, operator shall
notify the Gilsonite operator at least 48 hours prior to any blasting during construction.

e If paleontological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately
stop work and contact the Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will be made by the AO as
to what mitigation may be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material before
construction can continue.

Surface COAs:

» During operations, if any vertebrate paleontological resources are discovered, all operations
affecting such sites shall be immediately suspended, and all discoveries shall be left intact until
authorized to proceed by the Authorized Officer. The appropriate Authorized Officer of the
Vernal BLM office shall be notified within 48 hrs of the discovery, and a decision as to the
preferred alternative/course of action will be rendered.

e As in the APD the applicant has committed to not construct or drill from March 1% to August 15"
due to red-tailed hawk and burrowing owl habitat.
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DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs):

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE COAs:

The 7” casing cement shall extend a minimum of 200 feet above the 9 5/8” surface casing shoe.

Submit the MWD-GR survey from the directional/horizontal drilling operations, hard copy or
electronically.

Logging program: Run cement bond log in 7" from kick-off point to top of cement. Gamma Ray
shall be run from kick-off point to surface.

Variances Granted:

Air Drilling:

Properly lubricated and maintained rotating head, variance granted to use a properly maintained
and lubricated diverter bowl in place of a rotating head.

Blooie line discharge 100’ from the well bore, variance granted for blooie line discharge to be
50’ to 70’ from the well bore.

Automatic igniter or continuous pilot light on the blooie line and dust suppression equipment.
Variance granted for water injected into the compressed air to substitute for the pilot light and
dust suppression equipment.

Compressors located in the opposite direction from the blooie line a minimum of 100’ from the
well bore. Variance granted for truck mounted air compressor located within 50 feet from the
well bore on the opposite side from the blooie line.

All provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

DRILLING/COMPLETION/PRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

The spud date and time shall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding.

Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least 24 hours in
advance of casing cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure tests.

All requirements listed in Onshore Order #2 Ill. E. Special Drilling Operations are applicable for
air drilling of surface hole.

Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use until the well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times.
Choke manifolds shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

All BOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the
daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil &
Gas Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be
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performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and NOT by the rig pumps. Test shall be
reported in the driller’s log.

BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from
under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and
cemented in place.

No aggressive/fresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.
Cement baskets shall not be run on surface casing.

The operator must report all shows of water or water-bearing sands to the BLM. If flowing water
is encountered it must be sampled analyzed, and a copy of the analyses submitted to the BLM
Vernal Field Office.

The operator must report encounters of all non oil & gas mineral resources (such as Gilsonite,
tar sands, oil shale, trona, etc.) to the Vernal Field Office, in writing, within 5 working days of
each encounter. Each report shall include the well name/number, well location, date and depth
(from KB or GL) of encounter, vertical footage of the encounter and, the name of the person
making the report (along with a telephone number) should the BLM need to obtain additional
information.

A complete set of angular deviation and directional surveys of a directional well will be
submitted to the Vernal BLM office engineer within 30 days of the completion of the well.

While actively drilling, chronologic drilling progress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM,
Vernal Field Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum
Engineers until the well is completed.

A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the top of cement and
shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of
the CBL to this office.

Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Any changes in operation
must have prior approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.
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OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

All wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "Monthly Report of
Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which
operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and
abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management
Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-
3650 for reporting information.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLM Vernal Field office must be
notified when it is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be by written
communication and must be received in this office by not later than the fifth business day
following the date on which the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a
minimum, the following informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephone number.
o Well name and number.
o Well location (Y%, Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royaity will
be paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise
the non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.
o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.

All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will
be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A, shall be
reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than Major
Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events” will be reported on the
Monthly Report of Operations and Production.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days
after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys or
data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be
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filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well completion report a geologic report including,
at a minimum, formation tops, and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys,
sample descriptions, strip logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if
performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the
BLM, Vernal Field Office.

* All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease, shall have
prior written approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.

¢ QOil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The BLM Vernal Field
Office Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be
submitted to the BLM Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the API
standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement. All
measurement points shall be identified as the point of sale or allocation for royaity purposes.

* A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Qil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted
to the BLM Vernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs
first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively
sealed in accordance with Onshore Qil & Gas Order No. 3.

e Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filing of
a suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office. Emergency approval
may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

¢ No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30
days, prior approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office shall be obtained and notification given
before resumption of operations.

o Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but
no later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not
been approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-day period will be considered as an Incident
of Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this office.

Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in order
that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or abandoned, all pits
must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" (Form
BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual plugging of the well bore, showing
location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of casing left in hole, and the current status of
the surface restoration.
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: QUESTAR EXPL & PROD COMPANY

Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Api No: 43-047-40097 Lease Type: FEDERAL

Section__04 Township__08S Range_ 22E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor PETE MARTIN DRLG RIG#_RATHOLE
SPUDDED:

Date 08/19/08

Time 8:00 AM

How DRY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by KERRY SALES

Telephone # (435) 828-0339

Date 08/20/08 Signed CHD




FORM APPROVED

Fom 3160-5 UNITED STATES
(une 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR . Budget Bureas No. 10040135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT £ T Bapives: March 31, 1993
. "‘ 2 ﬁonxgd Serial No.
) SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS l UTU-02510A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry foa different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals - Iflndian, Allottee or Tribe Name
N/A
SUB Mﬁ'_i]—v TRIPLICATE b 1f Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
1. Typeof Well WHITE RIVER UNIT
oil Gas
wel E] well E] Other " Well Name and No.
WRU GB 14G 4 822
2. Name of Operator
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. . AP Well No.
3 Address and Telephone No. Contact: Dahn.Caldwell@questar.com 43-047-40097
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH - VERNAL, UT 84078 435-781-4342 Fax 435-781-4357 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
% Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description) WHITE RIVER
SURFACE: 600’ FSL, 2321’ FWL, SESW, SEC 4-T8S-R22E 1. County or Parish, State
BOTTOM: 1500’ FNL, 1750’ FEL, SWNE, SEC 9-T8S-R22E UINTAH
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of Tntent : E] Abandonmest D Change of Plans
D Recompletion D New Construction
Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D ‘Non-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair D Water Shut-Off

D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing D Convession to Injection
Other SPUD D Dispose Water

(Note) Report results of multipie completion on Well
C jon or R fetion Report and Log form )

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state ali pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

On 8/19/08 - Drilled 40° of 18” conductor hole. Set 40° of 14” conductor pipe. Cmtd w/ Ready Mix.

On 8/20/08 — Drilled 12-1/4” hole and run 12 jts 9-5/87, J-55, 36# csg & set @ 499’ GL. Cmtd w/ 310 sxs cmt.

‘/’,,
&
]

RECEIVED
AUG 5 2008
DIV, OF OlL; GAS & MINING

3 -BLM, 2- Utah OG&M, 1 Ner, 1 - file Me-server
. ~/l \n)

4. 1 l‘meby certify that the foregoing is and correcy. r
Signed Tyahn F. Caldwell , Office Administator 11 Date 8/20/08

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

i

respa g—

2 ML ap e -
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any faldes Sesitious ¢ t fean diilent statEnrents or.

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.




Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(November 1990 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR C ON F ’ D E NT B uy 31, 1996
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT l AL 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-02510A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
N/A

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse Side

1. Type of Well WHITE RIVER UNIT
X oit wen [ JGaswen [__] Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
Questar Exploration & Productlon Co. Contact: _Jan Nelson 9. APLWell No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-40097
11002 East 17500 South Vernal, Utah 84078 435-781-4331 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)} WHITE RIVER
600" FSL 2321' FWL, SESW, SECTION 4, T8S, R22E SURFACE LOCATION 11. County or Parish, State
1500' FNL 1750' FEL, SWNE, SECTION 9, 78S, R22E BOTTOM HOLE LOCATION UINTAH
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[X] Notice of Intent [ Acidize X Deepen [ Production (Start/Resume) [] water Shut-Off
[ Atter Casing [ Fracture Treat [ Reclamation » 1 well Integrity
[] subsequent Report [ Casing Repair (] New Construction  [__] Recomplete I:l Other
] Change Plans ] Plug and Abandon [1 Temporarily Abandon
I Final Abandonment Notice [] convert to Injection 1] Plug Back [] water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be perfaamed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
Following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Foarm 3160-4 shall be filed once
Testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Questar Exploration & Production Company requests a change in the bottom hole location in order to drill a longer lateral to
increase the drainage area of the horizontal wellbore. In addition, the wellbore casing design will change to leave the horizontal
portion of the lateral open hole. Production casing will still be set through the bunld section an lnto he reservoir zone as

originally planned. Utgtzol\jlfwsmn of
JSyos’ FNU - Qil, Gas and Mining
Please see Attached: 205" Fel

;; Fii?e?/\::eeddg-;oc;ﬁ? lpjlr:n : L3270 9 X Date: %’KZ@““O%( n_
o o "oy st rooreron 14402 €Y py: o SUINRBCEIVED

Date: 3*2 1-2008 o 234?:‘31{? - \ AUG 25 2008

Inttials; KD - 194 wet DIV.OF Ol &

14. Thereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Laura Bills Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

Signature % . Date
/4 August 22, 2008

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL.OR STATE USE .
Approved by Title lT)ate

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify ~ |Office
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to aﬂy department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or

CONFIDENTIAL

frandulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.




QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION

WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
New Horizontal Well
Summarized Procedure

MIRU air rig.

Drill 12 % surface hole to 499°+,

Run 9 5/8”, 36#, J-55, STC casing and cement to surface.

RD air rig, move off location.

MIRU drilling rig.

NU rig’s 3,000 WP rated BOP. Test BOP’s and surface casing.

PU straight hole BHA, drill out surface casing and 10’ of new formation, run FIT.
Drill 8 34” hole to 5,000°.

TOOH, PU directional BHA, TIH.

Drill to 5,286, kick off and drill well at a 158° azimuth with 14°/100° build rates
to land in G1 Lime formation at a TVD of +/- 5,695°, 5,938’ MD.

11. Drill in zone to 5,938 MD. TOOH, LDDP.

12. PU and run 77, 26#, N-80 or HCP-110, LTC casing to 5,938’, cement casing.

13. PU 3 ¥2” DP, directional BHA, TIH.

14. Drill +/- 2,831° of lateral in G1 Lime.

a. Mud system to be a NaCl weighted water based mud, weights are expected to

XN -

_.
e

be in the 8.8 — 9.2 ppg range.
15. Circulate and condition hole, TOOH, LDDP.
16. RU wireline, RTH and set RBP @ +/- 4,500° to isolate lateral.
17.  ND BOP’s.
18. RDMO.



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO.
WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil & Gas No. 1, and the
approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of its
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure
compliance.

1.

Formation Tops

The estimated top of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth, TVD Depth, MD
Green River 2,980° 3,450’
Kick Off Point 5,286’ 5,286’
Green River (G1 Lime) 5,695’ 5,938’
TD 5,627 8,769’

Anticipated Depths of Qil, Gas, Water, and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas, or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered as follows:

Substance Formation Depth, TVD Depth, MD
Oil/Gas Green River (G1 Lime) 5,695° — 5,627 5,938 — 8,769’

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling will
be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested
to determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted.
Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits Valley water right A36125 (which was
filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March
25, 1960). It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right
number filed before 1989 is not depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to
supply fresh water for drilling purposes. All water resulting from drilling operations
will be disposed of at Red Wash Central Battery Disposal site; SWSE, Section 27,
T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site; SWNW, Section 12, T8S, R21E.

Page 1 of 4



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP UINTA BASIN, INC
WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

3. Operator’s Specification for Pressure Control Equipment

A. 3,000 psi double gate, 3,000 psi annular (schematic attached)
B. Function test daily.

C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.22 psi/ft or 1,500 psi, whichever
is greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not
exceed the internal yield of the casing.

D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to rated
working pressure if isolated by a test plug or to 50% of the internal yield
pressure of casing, whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet
the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2 for equipment
and testing requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 3M system and individual
components shall be operable as designed.

4, Casing Program

Hole Casing | Top, | Bottom, | Weight, Grade | Thread | Condition
Size Size MD MD Lb/ft
17157 14” sfc 40° Steel Cond None Used
12 Y4 95/8” sfc 499 36.0 J-55 STC New
8 34~ 7’ sfc 5,938 26.0 N-80 or LTC New
HCP-110
Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile

(minimum)

95/8" | 36.0Ib. J-55 STC | 2,020 psi 3,520 psi 394,000 Ib.
7" 26.0 Ib. N-80 LTC | 5,410 psi 7,240 psi 519,000 Ib.

7" 26.01b. | HCP-110 | LTC | 7,800 psi 9,950 psi 693,000 1b.

The 7” casing will be N-80 or HCP-110 depending on what’s available.
The lateral portion of this wellbore will be left open hole.

Please refer to the attached wellbore diagram and re-entry procedure for further
details.

5. Auxilliary Equipment
A. Kelly Cock — Yes

B. Float at the bit — No
Page 2 of 4



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO.
WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system — visually and/or PVT or Flow
Show

D. Fully opening safety valve on the rig floor — Yes

E. Rotating Head — Yes

If drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6” in diameter and extend at least 100’ from
the wellbore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when
drilling below 500)

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold

I A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of
the blooie lines for dust suppression.

Drilling of the lateral will be done with fresh water KCl based mud systems
consisting primarily of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash,
polymers, and KCI. No chromates will be used. It is not intended to use oil in the
mud, however, in the event it is used the concentration will be less than 4% by
volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 9.5 ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.
PVT/Flow show will be used upon exit of existing production casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used upon exit of existing production casing to TD.

6. Testing, Logging, and Coring Program

A. Cores — None Anticipated
B. DST — None Anticipated

C. Logging:
i. Mud logging from casing exit to TD
ii. MWD-GR will be utilized during drilling operations to aid in landing
the curve and maintaining the lateral within the desired zone.

D. Formation and completion interval: H4a Lime interval, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of mud logging data. Stimulation:
stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest encountered.

Page 3 of 4



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO.
WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

7. Cementing Program

20" Conductor:
Cement to surface with construction cement.

9-5/8" Surface Casing: sfc — 499' (MD)

Lead/Tail Slurry: 0° — 499°. 170 sks (310 cu ft) Rockies LT cement + 0.25 1b/sk
Kwik Seal + 0.125 1b/sk Poly-E-Flake. Slurry wt: 13.5 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.81 ft*/sk,
Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 100% excess.

7" Intermediate Casing: sfc - 5,938' (MD)

Lead/Tail Slurry: 0° — 5,938°. 900 sks (1100 cu ft) 50/50 Poz Premium + 0.6%
Halad (R)-322 fluid loss + 2.0% Microbond M expander + 5% salt + 0.125 Ib/sk
Poly-E-Flake. Slurry wt: 14.35 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.24 ft*/sk, Slurry volume: 8-3/4"
hole + 25% excess.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H,S has been
encountered or is known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the
general area. Maximum anticipated bottom-hole pressure equals approximately 2,800
psi. Maximum anticipated bottom hole temperature is approximately 120°F.

Page 4 of 4



WRU 14G-4-8-22
API # 43-047-
Proposed WBD
Uinta Basin

Sec 4-T8S-R22E, UINTAH CO, UT

KB 5,187'
GL51771

NOTE: NOT TO SCALE

KOP 5,286' —__:
\’*

Updated 8-21-08 CJL

9 5/8" 36# J-55 @ 499'
§12 3/4" Hole Size

.
“eus
P tecrmmmessssasas

7" 26# N-80 or HCP-110
\f,gss' MD 5,695' TVD
SSE Lateral

......................................

8,769' MD 5,627 TVD

..................... l
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Questar Exploration & Production

Uintah County, UT NAD27
WRU GB

WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

OH

Plan: Plan #1

Standard Planning Report

21 August, 2008



Scientific Drilling
Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Multi-User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
Company: Questar Exploration & Production TVD Reference: GL 5171' & RKB 16' @ 5187.00ft (Ensign 57)
Project: Uintah County, UT NAD27 MD Reference: GL 5171 & RKB 16" @ 5187.00ft (Ensign 57)
Site: WRU GB North Reference: True
Well: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: OH
Design: Plan #1
Project Uintah County, UT NAD27
Map System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solution) System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
Map Zone: Utah Central 4302
site " WRU GB,
Site Position: Northing: 666,889.69 Latitude: 40° 8' 45.440 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,577,882.011t Longitude: 109° 25' 57.500 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.00 ft Slot Radius: in Grid Convergence: 1.32°
Weil WRU GB 14G-4-8-22, 600' FSL 2321' FWL Sec 4 T8S R22E
Well Position +N/-8 -0.01 ft Northing: 666,845.53 ft Latitude: 40° 8'45.900 N
+E/l-W 0.00 ft Easting: 2,573,945.00 ft Longitude: 109° 26' 48.200 W
Position Uncertainty 0.00 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 5,171.00 ft
Welibore OH
Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength
) ¢ (nT)
{GRF2005-10 2008/08/21 11.42 66.08 52,719
Design Plan #1
Audit Notes:
Version: Phase: PLAN Tie On Depth: 0.00
Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +N/-S +EI-W Direction
) ®) () ©)
-3.00 -0.01 0.00 157.36
Plan Sections
Measured - Vertical _ Dogleg ) ‘Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth +N/-8 +EI-W Rate Rate Rate TFO
{ft) ©) ©) {ft) (ft) () (°/100ft) (°/1001t) (°1100ft) ) Target
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,286.00 0.00 0.00 5,286.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,938.42 91.37 157.36 5,695.00 -386.63 161.25 14.00 14.00 0.00 157.36
8,768.63 91.38 157.36 5,627.00 -2,998.01 1,250.35 0.00 0.00 0.00 7.70 WRU B 14G-4-8-22 P

2008/08/21 12:18:55PM
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Scientific Drilling
Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Multi-User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
Company: Questar Exploration & Production TVD Reference: GL 5171' & RKB 16' @ 5187.00ft (Ensign 57)
Project: Uintah County, UT NAD27 MD Reference: GL 5171' & RKB 16' @ 5187.00ft (Ensign 57)
Site: WRU GB North Reference: True
Well: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Survey Calculation Method: * Minimum Curvature
Weilbore: OH
Design: Plan #1
Planned Survey
Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Iriclination Azimuth Depth +N/-$ +EI-W Section Rate Rate Rate
() ©) ©) (i)} () (ft) ({ft) (°/100ft) (°/1001t) (°100ft)
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
100.00 0.00 0.00 100.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
200.00 0.00 0.00 200.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
300.00 0.00 0.00 300.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
400.00 0.00 0.00 400.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
500.00 0.00 0.00 500.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
600.00 0.00 0.00 600.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
700.00 0.00 0.00 700.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
800.00 0.00 0.00 800.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
900.00 0.00 0.00 900.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,000.00 0.00 0.00 1,000.c0 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,100.00 0.00 0.00 1,100.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,200.00 0.00 0.00 1,200.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,300.00 0.00 0.00 1,300.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,400.00 0.00 0.00 1,400.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,500.00 0.00 0.00 1,500.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,600.00 0.00 0.00 1,600.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,700.00 0.00 0.00 1,700.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,800.00 0.00 0.00 1,800.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1,900.00 0.00 0.00 1,900.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,000.00 0.00 0.00 2,000.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,100.00 0.00 0.00 2,100.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,200.00 0.00 0.00 2,200.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,300.00 0.00 0.00 2,300.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,400.00 0.00 0.00 2,400.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,500.00 0.00 0.00 2,500.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,600.00 0.00 0.00 2,600.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,700.00 0.00 0.00 2,700.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,800.00 0.00 0.00 2,800.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,900.00 0.00 0.00 2,900.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2,982.00 0.00 0.00 2,982.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Uinta
3,000.00 0.00 0.00 3,000.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,100.00 0.00 0.00 3,100.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,200.00 0.00 0.00 3,200.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,300.00 0.00 0.00 3,300.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,400.00 0.00 0.00 3,400.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,500.00 0.00 0.00 3,500.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,600.00 0.00 0.00 3,600.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,700.00 0.00 0.00 3,700.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,800.00 0.00 0.00 3,800.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3,900.00 0.00 0.00 3,900.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,000.00 0.00 0.00 4,000.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,100.00 0.00 0.00 4,100.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,200.00 0.00 0.00 4,200.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,300.00 0.00 0.00 4,300.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,400.00 0.00 0.00 4,400.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,500.00 0.00 0.00 4,500.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,600.00 0.00 0.00 4,600.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,700.00 0.00 0.00 4,700.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,800.00 0.00 0.00 4,800.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,900.00 0.00 0.00 4,900.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,000.00 0.00 0.00 5,000.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
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Scientific Drilling

Planning Report

Database: EDM 2003.16 Multi-User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Company: Questar Exploration & Production TVD Reference: GL 5171' & RKB 16' @ 5187.00ft (Ensign 57)

Project: Uintah County, UT NAD27 MD Reference: GL 5171' & RKB 16' @ 5187.00ft (Ensign 57)

Site: WRU GB North Reference: True

Weli: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Survey Calcuiation Method: Minimum Curvature

Wellbore: OH

Design: Plan #1

Planned Survey

Measured Vertical Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth Inclination Azimuth Depth - +NI-S +EI-W Section Rate Rate Rate
(ft) ©) ©) )y (ft) (ft {ft) {°11o0ft) (°11001t) (°1100ft)
5,100.00 0.00 0.00 5,100.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,200.00 0.00 0.00 5,200.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,286.00 0.00 0.00 5,286.00 -0.01 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,300.00 1.96 157.36 §5,300.00 -0.23 0.09 0.24 14.00 14.00 0.00
5,400.00 15.97 157.36 5,398.53 -14.58 6.07 15.78 14.00 14.00 0.00
5,500.00 29.97 157.36 5,490.37 -50.50 21.06 54.70 14.00 14.00 0.00
5,600.00 43.97 157.36 5,570.07 -105.87 4415 114.70 14.00 14.00 0.00
5,700.00 57.98 157.36 5,632.87 -177.40 73.98 192.19 14.00 14.00 0.00
5,800.00 71.98 157.36 5,675.06 -260.82 108.78 282.59 14.00 14.00 0.00
5,900.00 85.99 157.36 5,694.11 -351.19 146.47 380.50 14.00 14.00 0.00
5,909.79 87.36 157.36 5,694.68 -360.22 150.23 390.28 14.00 14.00 0.00
G1 Lime Top Porosity
5,838.00 91.31 157.36 5,695.01 -386.24 161.09 418.48 14.00 14.00 0.00
Intermediate Casing

5,938.42 91.37 157.36 5,695.00 -386.63 161.25 418.90 14.00 14.00 0.00
6,000.00 91.37 157.36 5,693.53 -443.45 184.95 480.46 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,100.00 91.37 157.36 5,691.14 -535.72 223.43 580.43 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,200.00 91.37 157.36 5,688.74 -627.98 261.91 680.40 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,300.00 91.37 157.36 5,686.35 -720.25 300.40 780.37 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,400.00 91.37 157.36 5,683.96 -812.52 338.88 880.34 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,500.00 91.37 157.36 5,681.56 -904.79 377.36 980.32 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,600.00 91.37 157.36 5,679.16 -997.06 415.84 1,080.29 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,700.00 91.37 157.36 5,676.77 -1,089.32 454.33 1,180.26 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,800.00 91.37 157.36 5,674.37 -1,181.59 492.81 1,280.23 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,900.00 91.37 157.36 5,671.97 -1,273.86 531.29 1,380.20 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,000.00 91.38 157.36 5,669.57 -1,366.13 569.77 1,480.17 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,100.00 91.38 157.36 5,667.17 -1,458.40 608.25 1,580.14 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,200.00 91.38 157.36 5,664.77 -1,550.66 646.73 1,680.11 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,300.00 91.38 157.36 5,662.37 -1,642.93 685.22 1,780.09 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,400.00 91.38 157.36 5,659.97 -1,735.20 723.70 1,880.06 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,500.00 91.38 157.36 5,657.56 -1,827.47 762.18 1,880.03 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,600.00 91.38 157.36 5,655.16 -1,919.74 800.66 2,080.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,700.00 91.38 157.36 5,652.75 -2,012.00 839.14 2,179.97 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,800.00 91.38 157.36 5,650.35 -2,104.27 877.62 2,279.94 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,900.00 91.38 157.36 5,647.94 -2,196.54 916.10 2,379.91 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,000.00 91.38 157.36 5,645.53 -2,288.81 954.58 2,479.88 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,100.00 91.38 157.36 5,643.12 -2,381.08 993.06 2,579.85 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,200.00 91.38 157.36 5,640.72 -2,473.35 1,031.54 2,679.83 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,300.00 91.38 157.36 5,638.31 -2,565.61 1,070.03 2,779.80 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,400.00 91.38 157.36 5,635.89 -2,657.88 1,108.51 2,879.77 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,500.00 91.38 157.36 5,633.48 -2,750.15 1,146.99 2,979.74 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,600.00 91.38 157.36 5,631.07 -2,842.42 1,185.47 3,079.71 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,700.00 91.38 157.36 5,628.66 -2,934.69 1,223.95 3,179.68 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,768.63 91.38 157.36 5,627.00 -2,998.01 1,250.35 3,248.29 0.00 0.00 0.00
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Scientific Drilling

Planning Report
Database: EDM 2003.16 Multi-User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
Company: Questar Exploration & Production TVD Reference: GL 5171' & RKB 16' @ 5187.00ft (Ensign 57)
Project: Uintah County, UT NAD27 MD Reference: GL 5171' & RKB 16' @ 5187.00ft (Ensign 57)
Site: WRU GB North Reference: True
Weli: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: OH
Design; Plan #1
Targets
Target Name
- hitmiss target Dip Angle  Dip Dir. TVD +N/-S +E/W Northing Easting )
- Shape ©) ) (fty () (ft) (ft) () Latitude Longitude
WRU B 14G-4-8-22 PBt+ 0.00 0.00 5,627.00 -2,998.01 1,250.35 663,877.02 2,575,263.84 40° 8'16.270 N 109° 26' 32.100 W
- plan hits target center
- Point
Casing Points
Measured Vertical Casing Hole
"Depth Depth Diameter Diameter
(ft) {f) Name (in) (in)
5,938.00 5,695.01 Intermediate Casing 7.000 8.750
Formations
Measured Vertical . Dip
Depth Depth . Dip Direction
(ft) Af0) Name Lithology ) €
2,982.00 2,982.00 Uinta 0.00 0.00
5,909.79 5,704.00 G+ Lime Top Porosity 1.40 325.00
5,708.00 G1 Lime Bottom Porosity 1.40 325.00

2008/08/21 12:18:55PM

Page 5
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Project: Uintah County, UT NAD27 . .
e Site: WRU GB Questar Exploration & Production
a Scientific Dnllmg Well: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
Rocky Mountain Operations VVellbore: OH T MAzimuths to True North
Design: Plan #1 Magnetic North: 11.42°
WELL DETAILS: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Magnetic Field
Strength: 52718.6snT
GL 5171' & RKB 16' @ 5187.00ft (Ensign 57)  5171.00 Dip Angle: 66.08°
+N/-S +E/-W Northing Easting Latitude Longitude Date: 2008/08/21
-0.01 0.00 666845.53 2573945.00 40° 8'45900N  109° 26'48.200 W Model: IGRF2005-10
0 d 0 Gdo
\
\ .
475 350 \ Jntermedxate Cas|ng
\
950 -700 \
—_— \
1425 é:--mso \
o
S
T
1900 F:1400 X
. 006 £
E \
= 2
B2a75 1750 \
2 =
£ 3 \
a n
32850 -2100
3 \
b=
23325 2450 \
S
= \
3800 -2800 \
T ‘ WRU B 14G-4-8-22 PBH »
S T S L
T | LI 1
4275 -1750 -1400  -1050 -700 -350 0 350 700 1050 1400 1750 2100 2450 2800 3150
West(-)/East(+) (700 ft/in)
4750
Pian: Plan #1 (WRU GB 14G-4-8-22/0H)
Created By: Julie Cruse Date: 2008-08-21
5225 :
Intermediate Casing i WRU B 14G-4-8-22 PBHL PROJECT DETAILS: Uintah County, UT NAD27
A N 7 : | = Geodetic System: US State Plane 1927 (Exact solutiorﬂ
Ul - , , Datum: NAD 1927 (NADCON CONUS)
5700 ? ; = A { , Ellipsoid: Clarke 1866
' i ! ' ' Zone: Utah Central 4302
475 0 75 950 1425 1900 2375 2850 3325 3800 4275 4750 5225 5700 6175 6650 System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Vertical Section at 157.36° (950 ft/in) Local North: True North




CC 1938 Brass Cap 0.6’ High, Mound of Stones
SB89°59°48°F 339.55° (Meas.)

SE COR. SEC. 32
2" Bent Pijpe Buried 1.0’ Deep, Cap Missing

T8S, RRRE, S.L.B.&M.

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
Well location, WRU GB #14G—4-8-22 (SURFACE

N8G5702°E — 2642.89" (Meas.) A WEST — 2640.00° (G.L.O.) T'7S LOCATION), located as shown in the SE 1/4 SW
;?BH‘,’;’,‘,’” Cap T8S = 1/4 of Section 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M, Uintah
LOT 4 LOT 3 LOT 2 Lot1  ~f County, Utah.
N BASIS OF ELEVATION
’u? = BENCH MARK 20EAM LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION
2 35, 78S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE,
\3__ QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
- o~ (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
% 8 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
» LOT 5 LOT 6 LOT 7 LoT8 o ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 4697 FEET.
! = BASIS OF BEARINGS
Ly
(N BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.
:‘:
S
S M~
< LOT 9 g1S
o=
N[O
E 1/4 COR. SEC. 5 M |
1938 Brass Cap g
0.7" High ©
_f—soom 45"E 175.72" (Meas.) 5
( 4 :
1938 Bross Cop 0 © . ©
o o Hign | o (=] o
o o - bl
8 = -— o] o —
3 e T 3 T —
N THE PROPOSED BOTTOM '}3"% EF?54nng yeLL <
. IS LOCATED IN THE SW 1 z
= LOT 10 9, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. AT A DISTANCE OF S SCALE wn
S 2400° FNL 2050 FEL. IT BEARS S522°39'34°E B
E 3250.11° FROM THE PROPOSED WELL HEAD. CERTIFICATE ‘\\“; LA N'D""I
N ‘ = THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE Q,m% PREPAR D@g&
| 3 FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MASE EY MZ OR UNDERNYYR, ‘@
W 2 SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME AGE 0"
3 l © BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIER y L -
N N At Qe
S ~ HOFERTL. | = =
~ LOT 11 P —azNa =
S , WRU GB #14G—4—-8-22 REVISED: 08—14—08 REGISTRGED LAND SOROEYOR / &
S [ ] 2321 ’ EVISED: 08-14 REGISTRIGION NON1613 S
2 Elev. Ungraded Ground = 5171 REVISED: 06—-11—-08 STATE 0% N TN
L o REVISED: 03—20—08 ps = OF O (N
SE COR. SEC. 5 1938 Brass C l‘"ﬂ"“““—
frass Cop 3 poss G o7 High, Scatterd Unran ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
: ross Cop tones
A -
e SB957 33 W — 2974.55 (Meas.) S895819"W — 2640.16 (Meas.) 85 SOUTH 200 EAST VERNAL, UTAH 84078
Brass Cap (435) 789-1017
NO1'55'07"W 176.13° (Meos.)
SCALE DATE SURVEYED: | DATE DRAWN:
LEGEND: 1” = 1000’ 10-10-07 10-16—-07
—_— neATl PARTY REFERENCES
LATITUDE = 40°08'45.77" (40.146047)
L = 90 symBoL LONGITUDE = 109°26'50.67"_(109.447408) D.A. T.M. S.L. G.L.O. PLAT
- NAD 27 (SURFACE LOCATION
® - PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE = 400845.90" 240.146083) VEATHER R FILE
A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE = 109°26'48.20" (109.446722 WARM QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.




2642.08° (Meas.)

176.13° (Meas.)
SB8957°33"W — 2974.55° (Meas.)

ey  T8S, R22E, S.LB.&M. i

0.7 High, Scatterd
Stones

A S8958'19"W — 2640.16° (Meas.)

c.cC
Brass Caop

Bross

LOT 1

Cap _j

2400°

NOTE:

NOOO530"W — 2641.06" (Meas.)

QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

Well location, WRU GB #14G—4—-8-22 (BOTTOM
HOLE), located as shown in the SW 1/4 NE 1/4
of Section 9, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah County,

Utah. BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK 20EAM LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION 35,
T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE,
QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 4697 FEET.

! N THE PROPOSED BOTTOM HOLE FOR THIS WELL
e 1S LOCATED IN THE SW 1/4 NE 1/4 OF SECTION
3N 9, T8S, R22E, S.LB.&M. AT A DISTANCE OF
8 g 2400 FNL  2050° FEL. IT BEARS $22°39'34"E
I § LOT 2 3250.11" FROM THE PROPOSED WELL HEAD.
i)
R BOTTOM HOLE |
r%‘ WU GB %746—4—8—22 N 2050’
N |
K 9
; +5f'm Cop NOO'05'30"W — 19.80° (Meas.) A - -
g (] =] © [&]
S we .
.g ~ LOT 3 1938 Bross Cap, § e l.rO) [] =4
Plle of St
R BASIS OF BEARINGS ot | S T F—
SN BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. M SCALE
A 2 iy,
| 8 Ry CERTIFICATE (& o LAND l"’
LCERTIFICATE 8
| N N THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE qﬂ;%s, PREPAR %
. ! FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MARR &Y ME OR UNDERWY'. %
| & LOT 5 o LOT 6 LOT 7 2 SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME R D
B . ™ BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIES A o=
| B NB938°47°F &8 | k) BOD Pl D -
s LOT 4 125.57" (Meas.) Iy B //4 a =
| = o8 ) , S REGISTMED LAND OR/ S
N 1/4 Sec. 16 Sug S8913°06°F 65.46° (Meas.) g REGlSTRgN 16131 &
k 1938 Brass Cap, ) WC 1967 Brass 0.2" High CC 7938 Brass STATE O 7 o VT
Scattered Stones 0.32 (G.L.O.) Cap 1.5° High, /) oF \\\
. .L.O. Pile of Stones l'”b'"““\
NB9'32'50"W — 2678.97° (Meas.) exe a7 , — l’f” g4 Cor. Sec. IS,
- S89°35°31°F ~ 2679.51° (Meas.) 132 (GLOYD s Gres fe. T
?r:;s‘i/ /g:p, True Comner. \—589 2124°F — 2682.30° (Meas.)
16 Uwvtan ENGINEERING & LaND SURVEYING
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078
LEGEND: (435) 789-1017
|_ = 90°" SYMBOL R SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:
REVISED: 08-14-08f """ 4~ = 1000’ 10-10-07 06-11-08
@ = PROPOSED WELL HEAD.
A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED LATITUDE = 4008'16.14” (40.137817) | 1Y REFERENCES
= : LONGITUDE = 109'26'34.57" (109.442936 D.A. T.M. S.L. G.L.O. PLAT
A = SECTION CORNERS COMPUTED r:% TSEEZTA_R%T.Ogg?% H%)137853) WEATHER FILE
FROM G.L.O. (Not Set on Ground) LONGITUDE = 109°26'32.10" (109.442250) WARM QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.




State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

ENTITY ACTION FORM - FORM 6

ADDRESS:

OPERATOR ACCT. No. N-6085

(435)781-4342

OPERATOR: Questar Exploration & Production Co.
11002 East 17500 South
Vernal, Utah 84078

Action
Code

Current | New Entity APl Number Well Name

Entity No.
No.

QQ

§C

TP

RG

County

Spud Date Effective Date

&

99999 4q l 5 43-047-40097 | WRU GB 14G 4 8 22

SESW

4

8S

22

Uintah

8/19/08 270? < / D

WELL 1 COMMENTS: BOTTOM LOCATION - 1500" FNL, 1750' FEL, SWNE, SEC 9-T8S-R22E

CONFIDENTIAL

WELL 2 COMMENTS:

- 32008

RECEIVED

f\UG

WELL 3 COMMENTS:

WELL 4 COMMENTS:

WELL 5§ COMMENTS:

ACTION CODES (See instructions on back of form)

NOTE:
(3/89)

A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only)

B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity

E - Other (explain in comments section)

Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected

ignature

Office Administrator |1 8/20/08

Title

Date

Phone No. (435)781-4342

QQAIF!DEWAL

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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QuestarE & P Page 1 of 8

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:
Common Well Name:

WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Spud Date: 8/19/2008

Event Name: DRILLING Start: 8/20/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Ensign Drilling USD Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS(;Jdbe Phase Description of Operations
8/21/2008  |06:00 - 11:30 550|LOC |2 DRLCON |DRILL 40' OF 18" HOLE AND SET 14" CONDUCTOR PIPE. CEMENT
WITH READY MIX.
11:30 - 20:00 850|DRL |9 DRLSUR |HAMMER DRILL 12 1/4" HOLE FROM 40' TO 520'. BLOW DOWN
WELL
20:00 - 21:00 1.00| TRP 3 DRLSUR [LAY DOWN DRILL STRING.
21:00 - 22:00 1.00/C3G |2 CSGSUR |SAFETY MEETING. RUN 12 JOINTS OF 9 5/8", J55, 36#, LT&C PIPE
AS FOLLOWS: SHOE AT 499', FLOAT COLLAR AT 454.94'. RAN 3
CENTRALIZERS FROM 489' TO 373' AND ONE AT 84'.
NOTE: ALL MEASURMENTS ARE FROM GROUND LEVEL
22:00 - 00:00 2.00|CMT |2 CSGSUR |SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP AND CEMENT AS FOLLOWS: PUMP 40
BBL OF WATER, 10 BBL OF GEL SPACER. LEAD SLURY 15.8 PPG,
YEALD 1.15, GAL/SK 5, 63.4 BBL, 310 SKS. DISPLACE WITH 35.3
BBL, PLUG BUMPED, FLOATS HELD, 18 BBL OF CEMENT TO
SURFACE.
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| WOT |1 CSGSUR |WAIT ON CEMENT
06:00 - CSGSUR |CONTACT BLM MICHAEL LEE ON 8-18-08 AT 15:20 HRS FOR SPUD
CONDUCTOR ON 8-19-08 AT 08:00 HRS.
CONTACT UTAH STATE CAROL DANIELS ON 8-18-08 AT 15:25 HRS
FOR SPUD ON 8-19-08 AT 08:00.
CONTACT WONSIT VALLY DAHN CALDWELL AND RED WASH JAN
NEILSON WITH SPUD INFORMATION.
CALLED BLM JAMIE SPARGER ON 8-20-08 AT 07:40 HRS FOR
RUNNING CASING AND CEMENTING ON 8-20-08 AT 22:00 HRS.
8/31/2008 | 06:00 - 07:00 1.00{LoC |4 RDMO  |PRE-PAIR RIG FOR TRUCKS
07:00 - 18:00 11.00{LOC |3 RDMO  |MOVE RIG F/ GB 4W 9-8-22 TO THE WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
18:00 - 06:00 12.00|LOC |4 RDMO  [RIG UP & PRE-PAIR DERRICK TO BE RAISES THIS AM & MOVE
LIVING QUARTERS TO NEW LOCATION
90% RIGGED UP
9/1/2008 06:00 - 21:00 15.00|LOC |4 MIRU RAISE DERRICK / MOVE LIVING QUARETERS TO NEW LOCATION /
RIG UP FLOOR EQUIPMENT & FINISH RIGGING UP BACK YARD /
NOTIFIED JAKE BIRCHELL W/ THE UTAH BLM @ 1500 PM ON
8/31/2008 ON BOP TEST (VOICE MAIL)
21:00 - 02:00 5.00{BOP |1 MIRU NIPPLE UP BOP'S & CHANGE PIPE RAMS F/ 2 7/8" TO 4 1/2"
02:00 - 06:00 400/BOP |2 MIRU TEST BOP'S W/ B&C QUICK TEST / LOWER KELLY VALVE, UPPER
& LOWER PIPE RAMS, HCR / LEAK ON BOTTOM FLANGE /
TIGHTEN BOLTS ON FLANGE
9/2/2008 06:00 - 09:30 3.50|BOP |2 DRLIN1  |FINISH TESTING BOP'S W/ B& C QUICK TEST 3000 PSI HIGH 10
MIN, 250 PSI LOW FOR 5 MIN/TEST ANNULAR 1500 PSI T0MIN, 250
PSILOW 5 MIN / TEST 9 5/8 CASING TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MIN.
09:30 - 10:30 1.00|BOP |1 DRLIN1 |WAIT ON 9" WEAR RING
10:30 - 11:30 1.00/|BOP |1 DRLIN1  |INSTALL WEAR RING
11:30 - 15:00 3.50| TRP 1 DRLIN1 |PICK UP BHA TO DRILL 8 3/4" VERTICAL SECTION
15:00 - 17:00 200/DRL {4 DRLIN1 | TAG CEMENT @ 435' & DRILL SHOE TRACK TO 499' (FLOAT
COLLAR @ 454' & SHOE @ 499") 21' CEMENT & RAT HOLE TO 520'
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| DRL 1 DRLIN1  |DRILLING F/ 520' TO 530" (10' OF NEW FORMATION FOR F.LT)
17:30 - 18:00 0.50|CIRC |1 DRLIN1  |CIRCULATE SWEEP AROUND
18:00 - 18:30 0.50|EQT |2 DRLIN1  |FIT @ 530' W/ 8.4 PPG, 60 PS| SURFACE PRESSURE=10.6 PPG.
EQUIVILANT
18:30 - 22:00 3.50| DRL 1 DRLIN1 |DRILLING F/ 530" TO 1006’
22:00 - 22:30 0.50|SUR |1 DRLIN1  |RUN WIRELINE SURVEY @ 972' W/ 1.9 INC. 142.0 AZI.
22:30 - 00:00 1.50 | DRL 1 DRLIN1  |DRILLING F/ 1006' TO 1160'
00:00 - 00:30 0.50| RIG 4 DRLIN1  [INSTALL ROTATING HEAD / DRIVE BUSHING
00:30 - 05:30 5.00| DRL 1 DRLIN1  |DRILLING F/ 1160' TO 1877"

Printed: 10/2/2008 12:09:45 PM




QuestarE & P Page 2 of 8

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:
Common Well Name:
Event Name:
Contractor Name:

WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
DRILLING

Ensign Drilling USD

Spud Date: 8/19/2008
Start: 8/20/2008 End:
Rig Release: Group:

Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57
Date From - To | Hours | Code c%dbe Phase Description of Operations
9/2/2008 05:30 - 06:00 050/ SUR |1 DRLIN1 |SURVEY @ 1842
9/3/2008 06:00 - 15:00 9.00{DRL |1 DRLIN1  |DRILLING F/ 1877 TO 2529'
15:00 - 15:30 0.50|RIG 1 DRLIN1 |LUBRICATE RIG / FUNCTION HYDRIL, COM/GREASE SWIVEL,
CROWN
15:30 - 16:00 0.50|SUR |1 DRLINT  |RUN WIRELINE DEVIATION SURVEY 2495' 2 INC. 188.7 AZI.
16:00 - 19:30 3.50|DRL |1 DRLIN1 | DRILLIING F/ 2529' TO 2763'
19:30 - 22:00 2.50| RIG 2 DRLINT |WORK ON PUMPS
22:00 - 02:30 450/DRL |1 DRLIN1 |DRILLING F/ 2763' TO 2995'
02:30 - 03:00 0.50|SUR |1 DRLINT  |RUN WIRELINE DEVIATION SURVEY 2955' 2.5 INC. 193.4 AZI.
03:00 - 06:00 3.00/DRL |1 DRLIN1 |DRILLING F/ 2995' TO 3151'
9/4/2008 06:00 - 08:00 200{DRL |1 DRLIN1  |DRILLING F/ 3151' TO 3182' (TIGHT HOLE @ 3151
08:00 - 11:00 3.00|FISH |6 DRLIN1  |WORK TIGHT HOLE (TIGHT F/ 3139' TO 3161")
11:00 - 13:00 2.00[CIRC |2 DRLIN1  |CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN / MUD UP W/ 36 VIS & 8.4 PPG / PUMP &
SPOT 50 BBL. LCM PILL ON BOTTOM
13:00 - 17:00 400|TRP |2 DRLIN1 | TRIP OUT OF HOLE CHANGE BIT & CHECK BHA
17:00 - 20:00 3.00|TRP |2 DRLIN1 |TRIP IN HOLE & PICK UP DRILLING JARS
20:00 - 21:30 1.50| REAM |1 DRLINT |REAM F/ 3122' TO 3182 :
21:30 - 06:00 850(DRL |1 DRLINT  |DRILLING F/ 3182' TO 3402' (LOSSING 884 BBLS. FOR THE LAST 24
HRS.)
9/5/2008 06:00 - 07:30 1.50|DRL |1 DRLIN1  |DRILLING F/ 3402' TO 3464'
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| SUR |1 DRLIN1  |WIRELINE DEVIATION SURVEY DEPTH 3429' INC. 3.3 CORR. AZI
206.43
08:00 - 13:00 5.00{DRL |1 DRLIN1  |DRILLING F/ 3464' TO 361¢'
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| RIG 1 DRLIN1 |RIG SERVICE / FUNCTION UPPER PIPE RAMS
13:30-03:00 | 13.50|DRL |1 DRLINT  |DRILLING F/ 3619' TO 3961'
03:00 - 03:30 0.50{SUR |1 DRLIN1 |WIRELINE DEVIATION SURVEY DEPTH 3960' INC. 1.1 CORR. AZI.
212.93
03:30 - 06:00 250 DRL |1 DRLIN1  [DRILLING F/ 3961' TO 4003'
9/6/2008 06:00 - 12:00 6.00/DRL |1 DRLIN1  |DRILLING F/ 4003' TO 4210' ROP @ 34'/HR.
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 1 DRLIN1  |RIG SERVICE / LUBRICATE RIG FUNCTION HYDRIL
12:30 - 21:30 9.00|DRL |1 DRLINT  [DRILLING F/ 4210 TO 4521' ROP @ 34/HR
21:30 - 22:00 0.50|SUR |1 DRLIN1  [WIRELINE DEVIATION SURVEY DEPTH 4521' INC. 1.2 CORR. AZI.
211.13
22:00 - 06:00 8.00/DRL |1 DRLIN1  |DRILLING F/ 4521' TO 4744' ROP @ 27'/HR.
9/7/2008 06:00 - 12:00 6.00|DRL |1 DRLIN1  |DRILING F/ 4744' TO 4958 ROP @ 35'HR.
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 1 DRLIN1 |RIG SERVICE / FUCTION UPPER PIPE RAMS
12:30 - 15:30 3.00/DRL |1 DRLINT  |DRILLING F/ 4956' TO 5049' ROP @ 31'/HR.
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| SUR |1 DRLIN1  |WIRELINE DEVIATION SURVEY (MISS RUN)
16:00 - 17:30 1.50{DRL {1 DRLIN1  |DRILLING F/ 5049' TO 5080' ROP @ 21'/HR.
17:30 - 18:00 050/ SUR |1 DRLINT  |WIRELINE DEVIATION SURVEY DEPTH 5045 INC. 1 CORR. AZI.
202.83
18:00 - 03:00 9.00|DRL |1 DRLIN1 | DRILLING F/ 5080' TO 5267' ROP @ 21'/HR.
03:00 - 05:30 2.50|CIRC |1 DRLIN1 |CIRCULATE 2 HIGH VIS SWEEPS / PUMP & SPOT LCM PILL @
3200'
05:30 - 06:00 050|SUR |1 DRLIN1 |DROP SURVEY / SET KELLY BACK
9/8/2008 06:00 - 12:30 850/ TRP |2 DRLIN1 | TRIP OUT OF HOLE F/ 5267' TO BHA (TIGHT HOLE @ 3150") LAY
DOWN VERTICAL HOLE BHA
12:30 - 16:00 3.50|DRL |3 DRLIN1  |PICK UP DIRECTIONAL BHA #1 / SCRIBE MWD, SURFACE TEST
MUD MOTOR, MAKE UP BIT #3
16:00 - 16:30 0.50|RIG 1 DRLIN1  |RIG SERVICE / FUNCTION PIPERAMS
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| TRP |2 DRLIN1 | TRIP IN HOLE W/ HWDP
18:00 - 19:00 1.00| REAM |1 DRLIN1 |WASH & REAM TIGHT SPOT 913' TO 955'
19:00 - 19:30 0.50|RIG 4 DRLIN1  |INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:
Common Well Name:
Event Name:
Contractor Name:

WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
DRILLING

Ensign Drilling USD

Spud Date: 8/19/2008
Start: 8/20/2008 End:
Rig Release: Group:

Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csoudbe Phase Description of Operations
9/8/2008 19:30 - 22:00 250|TRP |2 DRLIN1 | TRIP IN HOLE TO 5207
22:00 - 00:00 2.00|REAM |1 DRLIN1  |WASH & REAM F/ 5207 TO 5267"
00:00 - 06:00 8.00|DRL |2 DRLIN1  |SLIDE F/ 5267' TO 5315'
9/9/2008 06:00 - 13:30 7.50|DRL |2 DRLIN1  [SLIDE F/ 5315' TO 5390'
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| RIG 1 DRLIN1  |RIG SERVICE / FUNCTION HYDRIL
14:00 - 20:30 6.50|DRL |2 DRLIN1  |SLIDE F/ 5390' TO 5452'
20:30 - 22:00 1.50|CIRC |1 DRLIN1 |CIRCULATE & CONDITION HOLE / MIX, PUMP & SPOT LCM PILL @
3200
22:00 - 03:30 550|TRP |2 DRLIN1 | TRIP OUT OF HOLE F/ 5452' TO BIT # 3
03:30 - 06:00 250/DRL |3 DRLIN1 |ORIENT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
9/10/2008  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00| TRP 1 DRLIN1  |MAKE UP & ORIENT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS & SURFACE TEST MUD
MOTOR
07:00 - 08:00 1.00| RIG 1 DRLIN1  |RIG SERVICE / WORK ON CROWN-O-MATIC
08:00 - 18:30 1050/ TRP |2 DRLIN1 | TRIP IN HOLE & REAM TO 5452 (TIGHT HOLE @ 3000' TO 3270,
4326' TO 4610', 5000' TO 5100, 5320’ TO 5452'
18:30 - 23:30 5.00{DRL |2 DRLIN1  |SLIDE F/ 5452' TO 5496' ROP OF 9/HR.
23:30 - 01:30 2.00| DRL 1 DRLIN1 |ROTATING F/ 5496' TO 5526' ROP OF 15'/HR.
01:30 - 06:00 450|DRL |2 DRLIN1  |SLIDE F/ 5526' TO 5545' 4/HR.
9/11/2008  |06:00 - 15:00 9.00|DRL |2 DRLIN1 |SLIDE F/ 5545' TO 5607' = ROP 6.8 FPH
15:00 - 15:30 0.50|RIG 1 DRLINT |RIG SERVICE, GREASE CROWN BLOCKS, SWIVEL, FUNCTION
HYDRILL
15:30 - 18:30 3.00|DRL |2 DRLIN1 |SLIDE F/ 5607' TO 5638'= ROP 10.3 FPH
18:30 - 19:00 0.50|DRL |2 DRLIN1 |ROTATE F/5638' TO 5642' =8 FPH
19:00 - 06:00 11.00{DRL 2 DRLIN1  |SLIDE F/ 5642' TO 5700" = 5.2 FPH
9/12/2008  |06:00 - 14:00 8.00|DRL |2 DRLIN1 |DIRECTIONAL DRLG F/ 5700 TO 5762,,ROP 7.75' FPH
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 1 DRLIN1  |RIG SERVICE, GREASE CROWN BLOCKS, SWIVEL, FUNCTION
TEST HYDRILL
14:30 - 23:30 9.00|DRL |2 DRLIN1 |DIRECTIONAL DRLG F/ 5762' TO 5823', ROP 6.7 FPH
23:30 - 01:00 1.50| CIRC |1 DRLIN1 |PUMP SWEEP CIRC. BTMS UP, PUMP PILL
01:00 - 06:00 5.00| TRP 10 DRLIN1 |TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT
9/13/2008  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00| TRP 1 DRLIN1 |L/D MOTOR, MWD,& BIT
07:00 - 09:30 2.50| TRP 1 DRLIN1  |P/U MOTOR,ADJUST MOTOR, P/lU MWD, TEST MOTOR, INSTALL
BIT #5
09:30 - 11:00 150/ TRP |2 DRLIN1 | TRIP IN HOLE TO 1776'
11:00 - 11:30 0.50| REAM |1 DRLIN1 |REAM F/ 1776' TO 1807" (CIRC SOME GRAVEL UP)
11:30 - 13:00 150/ TRP |2 DRLIN1 | TRIP IN HOLE TO 5141
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| REAM |1 DRLIN1 |REAM F/ 5141’ TO 5186'
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| OTH DRLIN1 [CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB
14:00 - 21:00 7.00{REAM |1 DRLIN1  |REAM F/ 5488' TO 5823 (10' FILL)
21:00 - 06:00 9.00|DRL |2 DRLIN1 |DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/ 5823' TO 5898' ROP=8.3 FPH
9/14/2008  |06:00 - 14:30 8.50|DRL |2 DRLIN1 |DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/ 5898 TO 5949' (SLIDE 5898'-5918', ROT
5918'-5928', SLIDE 5928'-5949') ( ROP=6 FPH )
14:30 - 15:00 0.50|RIG 2 DRLIN1 |GREASE BLOCKS, SWIVEL, FUNCTION HYDRIL
15:00 - 23:30 850(DRL |2 DRLIN1 |DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/ 5949' TO 6027 (ROT 5649'-5964', SLIDE
5964'-5970") ( ROP= 9.1 FPH)
23:30 - 00:30 1.00| CIRC DRLIN1 |CIRC. BTMS UP, PUMP DRY PILL
00:30 - 04:00 3.50| TRP 15 DRLIN1 | TRIP OUT OF HOLE
04:00 - 06:00 2.00{ TRP 1 DRLIN1  |L/D MUD, FLEX NMDC, GAP SUB,EMHO SUB, NMDC, MOTOR AND
BIT
9/15/2008  |06:00 - 10:00 4.00|TRP |2 DRLIN1  |TRIP IN HOLE TO 5450'
10:00 - 11:00 1.00{ REAM |1 DRLIN1 |WASH AND REAM F/ 5450' TO 5825'
11:00 - 11:30 0.50|TRP |2 DRLIN1 | TRIP OUT HOLE TO 5518'
11:30 - 14:00 2.50| REAM |1 DRLIN1 |WASH AND REAM F/ 5518' TO 6027'

Printed: 10/2/2008 12:09:45 PM




QuestarE & P Page 4 of 8

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Common Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Spud Date: 8/19/2008
Event Name: DRILLING Start: 8/20/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Ensign Drilling USD Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS(;Jdbe Phase Description of Operations
9/15/2008  {14:00 - 15:30 150/ CIRC |1 DRLIN1 |PUMP SWEEP, CIRC. BTMS UP
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| TRP 14 DRLIN1  |SHORT TRIP 10 STANDS
16:00 - 18:00 200/ TRP |2 DRLIN1  |LAYING DOWN SINGLES ( PUMPING OUT OF HOLE )
18:00 - 19:00 1.00| TRP |2 DRLIN1 |TRIP IN HOLE TO 5455'
19:00 - 20:00 1.00|CIRC |1 DRLIN1 | MiX AND DISPLACE 45 BBL. 12 PPG PILL IN OPEN HOLE
20:00 - 21:00 1.00| TRP |2 DRLIN1 |TRIP IN HOLE TO 5657'
21:00 - 22:00 1.00{CIRC |1 DRLIN1  |MIX DISPLACEMENT PILL - 45BBL 12PPG IN PIPE
1

22:00 - 23:30 1.50| REAM DRLINT |REAMING 5672'-5735', HAD TO WASH TO GET DOWN, LOST TOTAL
RETURNS

23:30 - 00:00 0.50 TRP 14 DRLINT |TRIP TO BOTTOM 6027

00:00 - 02:00 2.00, CIRC DRLIN1  |COND AND CIRC, LOST TOTAL RETURNS, PUMP LCM SWEEP,

REGAINED RETURNS

-

02:00 - 04:00 2.00|CIRC |8 DRLIN1  |BUILD VOLUME AND WORK PIPE
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|TRP |14 DRLIN1 |KELLEY BACK AND PULL 10 STANDS
9/16/2008  {06:00 - 09:00 3.00 REAM |1 DRLIN1 |SHORT TRIP 10 STANDS
09:00 - 11:30 2.50|CIRC |1 DRLIN1 |CIRC. BTMS UP, (SAFETY MEETING W/ LAYDOWN CREW )
11:30 - 12:30 100|TRP |2 DRLIN1 | TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE 8 STANDS ( TIGHT SPOT FROM 5740' TO
5770')
12:30 - 15:30 3.00|TRP |3 DRLINT  |LAY DOWN 4.5" DRILL PIPE
15:30 - 16:00 050|TRP |2 DRLIN1 |TRIP IN 8 STANDS

16:00 - 17:30 1.50| OTH DRLIN1 |BREAK KELLY, PULL ROTATINGHEAD RUBBER

17:30 - 19:00 1.50| TRP 3 DRLIN1 |LAY DOWN 4.5" DRILL PIPE AND 4.5" HWDP

19:00 - 19:30 0.50| BOP 1 DRLIN1  |PULL WEAR BUSHING

19:30 - 21:00 1.50| CSG 1 DRLIN1  |RIG UP CASING CREW , HELD SAFETY MEETING

21:00 - 04:30 7.50| CSG 2 DRLIN1  |RUN 7" 26# HCP-110 CASING TO 6020’

04:30 - 05:00 0.50| CSG 1 DRLIN1  |RU 7" CIRC SWEDGE AND WORK PIPE RIG DOWN CASING CREW

05:00 - 06:00 1.00| CIRC 1 DRLIN1  |CIRC AND CONDITION FOR CEMENT WHILE WORKING PIPE, GOT
CSG TO 6023', RU HES CEMENTERS

9/17/2008 06:00 - 06:30 0.50{RIG 7 CSGIN1 |HELD SAFETY MEETING W/ CEMENTERS

06:30 - 08:00 1.50| CMT 1 CSGIN1 |RIG UP HALLIBURTON TO CEMENT 7" CASING

08:00 - 14:30 6.50| CIRC 1 CSGIN1T |WORK 7" CASING AND CIRC. ( WAIT ON ANOTHER PUMP TRUCK )

14:30 - 15:00 0.50(RIG 7 CSGIN1  |HELD ANOTHER SAFETY MEETING W/ CEMENTERS

15:00 - 18:30 3.50| CMT 2 CSGIN1 |CEMENT W/ HALLIBURTON,, 30 BBL SUPERFLUSH, 20 BBL H20,,
HALLIBURTON HI-FILL 40 SACKS 28 BBL H20 @ 10.5 PPG,, HI-FILL
LEAD CEMENT 300 SACKS 368 BBL H20 @ 11.0 PPG,, TAIL
CEMENT 315 SACKS ,PREMIUM-CLASS G REG.38 BBL. H20 @ 15.8
PPG

18:30 - 19:00 0.50| CMT 1 CSGIN1 |RIG DOWN CEMENTERS

19:00 - 21:00 2.00| BOP 1 CSGIN1 |NIPPLE DOWN BOP TO SET 7" CASING SLIPS

21:00 - 23:00 2.00,CsG 7 CSGIN1 |SET 7" CASING SLIPS @ 150K, CUT OFF CASING AND DRESS TOP
OF CUT OFF.

23:00 - 02:30 3.50( BOP 1 CSGIN1 |NIPPLE UP BOP AND CHANGE PIPE RAMS F/ 4.5" TO 3.5"

02:30 - 06:00 3.50| BOP 1 CSGIN1 |LAYDOWN 4.5" KELLY,PICKUP 3.5" 54' KELLY, ( 54" KELLY IS TO
LONG) PICK UP SHORTER 3.5" KELLY AND READY FOR TEST,
UPPER AND LOWER SAFETY VALVES, SAVER SUB

9/18/2008 06:00 - 09:00 3.00| BOP 2 DRLPRO |TEST PIPE RAMS, 250/5000 PSI, UPPER AND LOWER KELLY

VALVES 250/5000 PSI, CASING TO 1500PSI F/ 30 MIN.

09:00 - 09:30 0.50/ BOP 1 DRLPRO |SET 7" WEAR BUSHING

09:30 - 10:30 1.00| OTH DRLPRO [INSTALL KELLY DRIVE BUSHINGS

10:30 - 13:30 3.00| DRL 3 DRLPRO |PICKUP MWD, MOTOR, ORIENT MWD, SURFACE TEST
MOTOR,MAKE UP BIT

13:30 - 15:00 1.50| CSG 1 DRLPRO |RIG UP PICKUP MACH. AND GET FLOOR READY TO PICKUP 3.5"
STRING
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Operations'Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Common Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Spud Date: 8/19/2008
Event Name: DRILLING Start: 8/20/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Ensign Drilling USD Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number; 57
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS(;Jdbe Phase Description of Operations
9/18/2008  |15:00 - 00:00 9.00|TRP |2 DRLPRO |PICKUP 3.5" STRING TO FINISH DRILLING THE G-1 LIME
00:00 - 01:00 1.00{CSG |1 DRLPRO |RIG DOWN PICKUP MACH.
01:00 - 02:00 1.00|DRL |1 DRLPRO |DRILL CEMENT STRINGERS F/ 5875 TO 5913
02:00 - 03:30 1.50| OTH DRLPRO |RIGUP KELLY SPINNERS, INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER &
CENTER STACK
03:30 - 04:00 050|DRL |1 DRLPRO |DRILL CEMENT STRINGERS F/ 5913' TO 5977'
04:00 - 06:00 200/ DRL |1 DRLPRO |DRILL SHOE TRACK F/5977' TO 6023'
9/19/2008  |06:00 - 06:30 0.50(DRL |1 DRLPRO |DRILL F/ 6023' TO 6035'
06:30 - 07:00 0.50|EQT |2 DRLPRO |PREFORMF.LT (326 PSI,,10.0 PPG EQUIVALANT MUD WT ) HELD
BOP DRILL
07:00 - 10:30 3.50|DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6035' TO 6102’ , ROP= 19.1 FPH
10:30 - 12:30 2.00/DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6102' TO 6112', ROP=5 FPH
12:30 - 18:00 550|DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 8112' TO 6202, ROP= 16.3 FPH
18:00 - 19:00 1.00|DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6202' TO 6208, ROP= 6 FPH
19:00 - 19:30 0.50[DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6208' TO 6234', ROP = 52 FPH
19:30 - 20:00 0.50| RIG 2 DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE, GREASE CROWN,BOCKS,SWIVEL,FUNCTION
HYDRIL, (HELD BOP DRILL)
20:00 - 21:00 1.00|DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6234' TO 6250',, ROP = 16 FPH
21:00 - 22:00 1.00/DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6250’ TO 6261',ROP = 11 FPH
22:00 - 23:30 1.50|DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6261' TO 6298',,ROP = 24,6 FPH
23:30 - 01:00 1.50|DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6298 TO 6312',, ROP = 9.3 FPH
01:00 - 06:00 5.00|/DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6312' TO 6425’ ,, ROP = 22.6 FPH
9/20/2008 | 06:00 - 07:00 1.00[DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6425' TO 6454' ,,ROP = 29 FPH
07:00 - 09:30 250|DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6454' TO 6465' ,, ROP = 4.4 FPH
09:30 - 10:30 1.00(DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6465' TO 8489' ,, ROP = 24' FPH
10:30 - 13:00 250(DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6489' TO 6507' ,ROP=7.2 FPH
13:00 - 14:00 1.00{DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6507' TO 6521',, ROP = 14 FPH
14:00 - 14:30 050{DRL |2 DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE, GREASE BLOCKS, SWIVEL, FUNCTION HYDRIL
14:30 - 15:00 0.50|CIRC |5 DRLPRO |CIRC. UP SAMPLE @ 6510'
15:00 - 15:30 0.50/DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6521' TO 6536',,ROP= 30 FPH
15:30 - 18:00 2.50|WOT |2 DRLPRO |CIRC. AND WAIT ON ORDERS
18:00 - 19:00 1.00{CIRC |1 DRLPRO |CIRC. BUILD DRY PILL, FILL TRIP TANK, PUMP DRY PILL
19:00 - 23:00 400/ TRP |2 DRLPRO |TRIP OUT OF HOLE, TO CHANGE BIT AND MWD & RUN BOND LOG
23:00 - 00:00 1.00| TRP |1 DRLPRO |LAY DOWN MWD, BIT
00:00 - 03:00 3.00/LOG |2 DRLPRO |SAFETY MEETING W/ LOGGERS, R/U LOGGERS AND RUN BOND
LOG ( CEMENT TOP @ 2420')
03:00 - 04:30 150/ TRP |1 DRLPRO |SWAP OUT MUD MOTORS,PICKUP MWD & SCRIBE, SURFACE
TEST MUD MOTOR,M/U BIT #7
04:30 - 06:00 150| TRP |2 DRLPRO |TRIP IN HOLE W/ BIT #7,
9/21/2008  |06:00 - 06:30 0.50| TRP |2 DRLPRO |FUNCTION CROWN-O-MATIC AND TRIP IN HOLE
06:30 - 07:00 0.50| OTH DRLPRO |INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER& CORROSION RINGS, FILL
PIPE
07:00 - 07:30 0.50{TRP {2 DRLPRO |TRIP IN HOLE TO 5800'
07:30 - 09:00 1.50{ RIG 6 DRLPRO |SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE (150"
09:00 - 09:30 050|TRP |2 DRLPRO |RESET CROWN-O-MATIC AND TRIP IN HOLE
09:30 - 13:00 3.50} OTH DRLPRO |RELOG HOLE W/ GAMMA F/ 6127 TO 6327’
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| TRP |2 DRLPRO |PULL 3 STANDS
13:30 - 15:30 200/DRL |7 DRLPRO |TROUGH HOLE F/ SIDE TRACK @ 6141’
15:30 - 00:00 850|DRL |2 DRLPRO |TIME DRILLING F/ 6170' TO 6176 @ ONE MIN A FOOT
00:00 - 06:00 6.00{DRL I3 DRLPRO |TIME DRILLING F/6176' TO 6185' @ 2 MIN A FOOT
9/22/2008  |06:00 - 11:00 500/ DRL |2 DRLPRO |TIME DRILL F/ 6185' TO 6195' 2 FPH
11:00 - 11:30 0.50|DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6195' TO 6202,,ROP= 14 FPH
11:30 - 13:00 1.50|CIRC |5 DRLPRO |CIRC. UP SAMPLE @ 6202
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Common Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Spud Date: 8/19/2008
Event Name: DRILLING Start: 8/20/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Ensign Drilling USD Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csoudbe Phase Description of Operations
9/22/2008  |13:00 - 14:00 1.00{DRL |2 DRLPRO |ROTATE DRILL F/ 6202' TO 6218',,ROP = 16 FPH
14:00 - 17:00 3.00{DRL |2 DRLPRO |HAND DRILL ATTEMPT TO GET BACK IN SIDETRACK #1 @ 1'
EVERY 2 MIN.
17:00 - 18:00 1.00{TRP |2 DRLPRO |LAY DOWN 4 JT. DRILL PIPE
18:00 - 18:30 0.50/DRL |3 DRLPRO |BUILD TROUGH F/ SIDETRACK F? 6128' TO 6140'
18:30 - 21:30 3.00/DRL |2 DRLPRO |TIME DRILL F/ 6140' TO 6141' @ 5 MIN. A FOOT
21:30 - 22:30 1.00|DRL |3 DRLPRO |LAY DOWN 1 JT. D.P. AND REBUILD TROUGH F/ 6110' TO 6140'
22:30 - 00:00 1.50|DRL |2 DRLPRO |TIME DRILL F/ 6140' TO 6141' ( STACKED ON 20k PICKUP 10 FT.
AND RESTART)
00:00 - 01:00 1.00|DRL |2 DRLPRO |TIME DRILL F/ 6141 TO 6141.8 ( WT STACKING ON BIT)
01:00 - 01:30 0.50| TRP |2 DRLPRO |LAY DOWN 5 JTS. D.P.
01:30 - 03:00 1.50| REAM 1 DRLPRO |REAM HOLE F/ 5964' TO 6110' ( REAM EACH JT. TWICE)
03:00 - 06:00 3.00|DRL |2 DRLPRO |TIME DRILL F/ 6140-41'
9/23/2008  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|CIRC |1 DRLPRO |CIRC., FILL TRIP TANK, BUILD DRY PILL, AND PUMP DRY PILL
07:00 - 12:00 5.00|TRP |2 DRLPRO |FUNCTION CROWN-O-MATIC, TRIP OUT OF HOLE
12:00 - 13:30 1.50| TRP |1 DRLPRO |CHANGE OUT MOTOR ,BIT, ORIENT MWD, SURFACE TEST
MOTOR, P/U SHOCK SUB
13:30 - 14:00 0.50|RIG 1 DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS
14:00 - 17:00 3.00/TRP |2 DRLPRO |TRIP IN HOLE 15 STANDS, PICK UP AGATATOR & SHOCK SUB

17:00 - 18:00 1.00| OTH DRLPRO |INSTALL ROTATINGHEAD RUBBER

18:00 - 19:30 1.50{ TRP 2 DRLPRO |FINISH TRIP IN HOLE

19:30 - 20:30 1.00| DRL 3 DRLPRO |ORIENTATE TOOLFACE IN TROUGH

20:30 - 06:00 9.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |TIME DRILL F/6141 TO 6147, TIME DRILL @ 1 FPH
9/24/2008 06:00 - 08:30 2.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |TIME DRILL F/ 6148' TO 6149' @ 1 FOOT PER HR.

08:30 ~ 11:00 2.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |TIME DRILL F/ 6149 TO 6155' @ 2 FOOT PER HR.

11:00 - 15:00 4.00| DRL 2 DRLPRO |TIME DRILL F/ 6155 TO 6163' @ 3 FOOT PER. HR.

15:00 - 21:00 6.00| DRL 2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6163' TO 6195' ,,ROP = 5.3 FEET PER HR.

21:00 - 21:30 0.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |ROTATE DRILL F/6195' TO 6203' ,,ROP = 16 FEET PER HR.

21:30 - 22:00 0.50(RIG 1 DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE, GREASE BLOCKS, SWIVEL FUNCTION PIPE RAMS

22:00 - 23:30 1.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/6203' TO 6218 ,,ROP = 10 FEET PER HR.

23:30 - 00:30 1.00| DRL 2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/6218' TO 6235' ,,ROP = 17 FEET PER HR.

2

00:30 - 03:30 3.00( DRL DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6235' TO 6266' ,,ROP = 10.3 FEET PER HR.
03:30 - 06:00 2.50 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/6266' TO 6298',, ROP = 12.8 FEET PER. HR.

9/25/2008 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| DRL 2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6298' TO 6318' ,,ROP =20 FEET PER HR.
07:00 - 09:00 2.00| DRL 2 DRLPRO {SLIDE DRILL F/ 6318 TO 6345' ,,ROP = 13.5 FEET PER HR.
09:00 - 10:30 1.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6345 TO 6377' ,,ROP = 21.3 FEET PER HR.
10:30 - 13:30 3.00( DRL 2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6377 TO 6393' ,ROP =5.3 FEET PER HR.
13:30 - 14:00 0.50(RIG 1 DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE, GREASE BLOCKS SWIVEL, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS
14:00 - 17:00 3.00( DRL 2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/6393' TO 6425',, ROP = 10.6 FEET PER HR.
17:00 - 19:00 2.00| DRL 2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 8425' TO 6457' ,,ROP = 16 FEET PER HR.
19:00 - 20:00 1.00| DRL 2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6457 TO 6472' ,,ROP = 15 FEET PER HR.
20:00 - 02:00 6.00! DRL 2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6472' TO 6615',, ROP = 23.8 FEET PER HR.
02:00 - 03:00 1.00{ DRL 2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6615' TO 6630' ,,ROP=15 FEET PER HR.
03:00 - 04:30 1.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6630' TO 6679',,ROP = 32.6 FEET PER HR.
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6679 TO 6686',,ROP = 3.5 FEET PER HR.
9/26/2008 06:00 - 10:30 4.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 8686' TO 6775',, ROP = 19.7 FEET PER HR.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| DRL 2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 6775 TO 6781',, ROP =6 FEET PER HR.
11:30 - 13:00 1.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6781' TO 6806',, ROP = 16.6 FEET PER HR.
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| RIG 1 DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE, GREASE BLOCKS, SWIVEL AND FUNCTION PIPE
RAMS
13:30 - 01:00 11.50| DRL 2 DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 6806' TO 7108',, ROP = 26.2 FEET PER HOUR
01:00 - 02:00 1.00| DRL 2 DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 7108 TO 7115',, ROP =7 FEET PER HR.

02:00 - 06:00 4.00| DRL

N

DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/ 7115' TO 7230',, ROP = 28.7 FEET PER HR.

Printed: 10/2/2008 12:09:45 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Common Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Spud Date: 8/19/2008
Event Name: DRILLING Start: 8/20/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Ensign Drilling USD Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSoudbe Phase Description of Operations
9/27/2008  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00{DRL |2 DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 7230' TO 7315, ROP @ 28'/HR.
09:00 - 10:00 1.00| TRP 14 DRLPRO |SHORT TRIP F/ 7315' TO 6751' 6 STDS.
10:00 - 10:30 0.50|DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE F/7315' TO 7322, ROP @ 14'/HR.
10:30 - 12:30 2.00{ DRL 1 DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 7322' TO 7379, ROP @ 28.5'HR.
12:30 - 13:00 0.50{RIG 1 DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE / FUNCTION ANNULAR
13:00 - 13:30 0.50{DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE F/ 7379' TO 7388', ROP @ 18/HR.
13:30 - 15:00 1.50{ DRL 1 DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 7388' TO 7431, ROP @ 17/HR.
15:00 - 16:00 1.00{DRL |2 DRLPRO |[SLIDE F/ 7431' TO 7442', ROP @ 11'/HR.
16:00 - 20:30 4.50| DRL 1 DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 7442’ TO 7538',ROP@ 21.3' /HR
20:30 - 21:30 1.00|DRL |2 DRLPRO |[SLIDE F/ 7538 TO 7553, ROP@15' / HR
21:30 - 23:00 150|DRL |2 DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 7553 TO 7591', ROP@ 25.3' /HR
23:00 - 00:00 1.00[CIRC |1 DRLPRO |FILL TRIP TANK, BUILD AND PUMP DRY SLUG
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP 2 DRLPRQ |TRIP OUT HOLE, LAY DOWN 2 JTS. ,L/D AGITATOR AND SHOCK
SUB
9/28/2008  |06:00 - 07:30 1.50| TRP 1 DRLPRO |PICK UP ORIENT MWD & SURFACE TEST MUD MOTOR
07:30 - 09:30 200|EQT |2 DRLPRO |INJECTION TEST /20 BBLS. TOTAL, PRESSURED UP TO 700 PSI
W/ 3 BBLS. IN, DROPED TO 400 PS} W/ 13 BBLS. IN, DROPED TO
350 PSI W/ 18 BBLS. IN, HELD 400 PSI WHEN PUMP SHUT OFF W/
A TOTAL OF 20 BBLS. PUMPED. PUMP RATE THROUGH JOB WAS
3 BBLS./MIN
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG 1 DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE / FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAMS
10:00 - 10:30 0.50|TRP |2 DRLPRO |TRIP IN HOLE F/ SURFACE TO 1500'
10:30 - 13:30 3.00| OTH DRLPRO |WAIT ON SHOCK SUB & AGITATOR / FIRST CALL WAS MADE @

5:30 AM TO NOV IN VERNAL. IT WAS SAID TOBE AETAOF 1.5
HRS. / SOS TRUCKING WAS THE TRUCKING COMPANY
DRLPRO |MAKE UP AGITATOR & SHOCK SUB / SURFACE TEST
DRLPRO |TRIP IN HOLE F/ 1500' TO 6205'

DRLPRO |OREINT & WORK THROUGH SIDE TRACK

DRLPRO |TRIP IN HOLE F/ 6205' TO 7510'

DRLPRO |SAFETY REAM F/ 7510' TO 7591'

DRLPRO |ROTARY DRILL F/7591' TO 7654', ROP=21,FPH
DRLPRO |SLIDE DRILL F/ 7655' TO 7666',,ROP=7.3 FPH
DRLPRO |(ROTARY DRILL F/ 7666’ TO 7750',,ROP =24 FPH
DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 7750' TO 7910", ROP @ 21'/HR.

DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE / FUNCTION PIPE RAMS (LOWER)
DRLPRO |SLIDE F/7910' TO 7915'

DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 7915' TO 7986', ROP @ 23'/HR.

DRLPRO |SLIDE F/7974' TO 7977', ROP@ 6 FPH

DRLPRO [DRILLING F/ 7977 TO 8230' ,ROP @ 24 FPH

DRLPRO |(SLIDE F/8230' TO 8250' , ROP@20 FPH

DRLPRO |(DRILLING F/ 8250' TO 8358', ROP @ 17'/HR

DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE

DRLPRO |[SLIDE F/8358' TO 8364' ROP @ 12/HR

DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 8364' TO 8390, ROP @ 13/HR.

13:30 - 14:00 0.50| TRP
14:00 - 16:30 2.50| TRP
16:30 - 19:30 3.00{ REAM
19:30 - 20:30 1.00; TRP
20:30 - 22:00 1.50| REAM
22:00 - 01:00 3.00|{ DRL
01:00 -~ 02:30 1.50( DRL
02:30 - 06:00 3.50| DRL
9/29/2008 06:00 - 13:30 7.50| DRL
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| RIG
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| DRL
14:30 - 17:30 3.00| DRL
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 | DRL
18:00 - 04:30 10.50| DRL
04:30 ~ 06:00 1.50| DRL
9/30/2008 06:00 ~ 12:30 6.50| DRL
12:30 - 13:00 0.50 RIG
13:00 - 13:30 0.50{ DRL
13:30 - 15:30 2.00| DRL

MN A A ANDaNN=aS SN2 aNNNN=aN=2NN

15:30 - 16:30 1.00| TRP 4 DRLPRO |SHORT TRIP F/ 8390' TO 787¢'

16:30 - 18:30 2.00| DRL DRLPRO |DRILLING F/8390' TO 8406' ROP@ 8 FPH
18:30 - 19:00 0.50| DRL DRLPRO |SLIDE F/ 8406' TO 8415' ROP @ 18FPH
19:00 - 20:00 1.00| DRL DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 8415' TO 8427' ROP @ 12 FPH

20:00 - 20:30 0.50{ DRL
20:30 - 00:00 3.50| DRL
00:00 - 01:00 1.00| DRL
01:00 - 06:00 5.00 DRL

DRLPRO (SLIDE F/ 8427 TO 8432' ROP@ 10 FPH
DRLPRO |[DRILLING F/ 8432' TO 8496' ROP @ 18.2 FPH
DRLPRO |SLIDE F/8496' TO 8506' ROP @ 10 FPH
DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 8506' TO 8613' ROP @ 21.4 FPH

NN NN

Printed: 10/2/2008 12:09:45 PM




QuestarE & P Page 8 of 8

Operations Summary Report .

Legal Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Common Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 Spud Date: 8/19/2008
Event Name: DRILLING Start: 8/20/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Ensign Drilling USD Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 57
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csoudbe Phase Description of Operations
10/1/2008 | 06:00 - 06:30 050|DRL |2 DRLPRO |[SLIDE F/ 8613' TO 8625', ROP @ 24'HR.
06:30 - 11:00 4.50 | DRL 1 DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 8625' TO 8709', ROP @ 19'/HR.
11:00 - 12:00 1.00{DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE F/8709' TO 8717', ROP @ 8'HR.
12:00 - 14:30 2.50| DRL 1 DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 8717' TO 8772, ROP @ 22'/HR.
14:30 - 15:00 0.50|RIG 1 DRLPRO |RIG SERVICE / FUNCTION HYDRIL
15:00 - 16:00 1.00/DRL |2 DRLPRO |SLIDE F/8772' TO 8782', ROP @ 10VHR.
16:00 - 18:30 2.50/DRL |1 DRLPRO |DRILLING F/ 8782' TO 8836'/ TD WELL
18:30 - 19:30 1.00/CIRC |1 DRLPRO |CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP FOR SAMPLE / MiX & PUMP DRY JOB
19:30 - 21:30 2.00{ TRP 14 DRLPRO |SHORT TRIP OUT OF HOLE F/ 8836' TO 6000' / UP IN SHOE
21:30 - 01:00 3.50| TRP 14 DRLPRO |TRIP IN THE HOLE F/ 6000' TO 8500"
01:00 - 06:00 5.00| REAM |1 DRLPRO |WASH & REAM TIGHT SPOTS @ 7600' TO 7700 & 8500' TO 8836'
10/2/2008 | 06:00 - 09:00 3.00| REAM |1 DRLPRO |REAMMING F/ 8600' TO 8836'
09:00 - 10:30 1.50|CIRC |1 DRLPRO |CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP & MIX, PUMP DRY JOB
10:30 - 13:00 250|TRP |2 DRLPRO |SHORT TRIP F/ 8836' TO 7600
13:00 - 14:30 1.50|CIRC |1 DRLPRO |CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP & MIX, PUMP DRY JOB
14:30 - 23:30 9.00| TRP |2 DRLPRO |TRIP OUT F/ 8836' TO BIT / LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL BHA / SLM
ON WAY OUT
23:30- 01:30 2.00|/CcsG |1 DRLPRO |HOLD SAFETY MEETING W/ WEATHERFORD CASING CREW & RIG
UP CASING EQUIPMENT
01:30 - 04:00 250|/CsG |2 DRLPRO |RUN 2734' OF 4 1/2" 11.6# P-110 LT&C PRODUCTION CASING

04:00 - 06:00 2.00|CSG 1 DRLPRO |PICK UP SETTING ADAPTER & RIG DOWN CASING CREW

Printed: 10/2/2008 12:08:45 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Common Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-22 . Spud Date: 8/19/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 10/8/2008 End: 11/12/2008
Contractor Name: Rocky Mtn Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: ROCKY MTN WS Rig Number: 3

Date From - To | Hours | Code CS(;Jdbe Phase Description of Operations
10/30/2008  |06:00 - 16:00 10.00| CMT 3 pump 250 sxs Class 'G' neat cmt squeeze. Had circ throughout job.

Pull up to 800" & reverse circ out tbg w/ 10 bbls KCL water. Pressure
well to 400 psi & SWIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Run CBL & determine cement top.

Casing Size: 7" 26# P-110
10/31/2008  |06:00 - 16:00 10.00| LOG 4 Completion

On 10/30/08 @ 7:00 AM - Open well. RIH f/ 800" w/ 2-7/8" tbg, tag cmt
@ 1515'. POOH w/ 2-7/8" tbg. RU Cutters WL & run CBL f/ 1490' -
400'. Tagged cmttopin 7" @ 1494'. Cement top in annulus @ 1000',
very spotty bond from top to about 750". Perforate 7' w/ 8 holes @
900-902'. RD Cutters WL. RIH w/ 13 stands 2-7/8" tbg to 860". RU
ProPetro cementers. Pressured up to 1500 psi on squeeze perfs. No
break or circ up 7" annulus. RD cementers & POOH w/ 13 stands
2-7/8" tbg. SWIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Acidize to get circulation then cement.

Casing Size: 7" 26# P-110
11/3/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| STIM 1 Completion

On 10/31/08 @ 7:00 AM - RIH w/ 14 stands of 2-7/8" thg to 910". Rig up
Superior and spot 600 gals of 15% HCL across perfs @ 900’ - 902"
POOH w/ tbg. Pump acid into squeeze perfs @ 1.7 BPM & 1500 psi.
No circ up 7" annulus. RD acid crew. RIH w/2-7/8" thg to 1032' & circ
up any remaining acid from well. Pull up to 891' & spot 75 sxs Class 'G'
cement plug. POOH w/ tbg & displace cmt into perfs @ 900' - 902"
Leave 830 psi on squeeze. SWIFW. Rig down cementers.

24 Hour Forecast: Drill out cement.

Casing Size: 7" 26# P-110

11/4/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| STIM 1 Completion

On 11/3/08 @ 7:00 AM - RIH w/ 6-1/8" drag bit & 2-7/8" workstring, tag
cement @ 830". RU Power Swivel and begin drilling. Drill out cement
from 830" - 910"; 1480' - 1520' & 2041' - 2250". Circ ¢csg clean, drain
lines. SDFN @ 5:00 PM.

24 Hour Forecast: Continue to drill out cement, retrieve RBPs..

Casing Size: 7" 26# P-110

11/5/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| DRL 4 Completion

On 11/4/08 @ 7:00 AM finish drilling out cement from 2250' to 2350".
RIH & tag 7" RBP @ 2440, circ clean, POOH w/ 6-1/8" bit. RIH w/
retrieving tool, circ on to RBP @ 2440'. POOH w/ retrieving tool, did not
have RBP. RIH w/ retrieving tool, and attempt to latch on to RBP, no
success. Clrc out cement & pieces of CICR, POOH w/ thg & retrieving
tool. Drain up, secure well and SDFN @ 5:00 PM.

24 Hour Forecast: Retrieve RBP.

Printed: 12/1/2008 10:27:23 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:
Common Well Name:

WRU GB 14G-4-8-22
WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Spud Date: 8/19/2008

Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 10/8/2008 End: 11/12/2008

Contractor Name: Rocky Min Well Service Rig Release: Group:

Rig Name: ROCKY MTN WS Rig Number: 3

Date From - To | Hours | Code géjdbe Phase Description of Operations

11/5/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| DRL 4 Casing Size: 7" 26# P-110

11/6/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| DRL 4 Completion
On 11/5/08 @ 7:00 AM RIH w/ retrieving too! and 2-7/8" workstring, circ
over & release RBP @ 2440', POOH. RIH w/ retrieving tool & 2-7/8"
workstring, circ out drilling mud, release RBP @ 5010', pull up w/ RBP
to 1500', secure well, drain up lines, SDFN @ 5:00 PM.
24 Hour Forecast: RIH w/ tbg to TD, acidize.
Casing Size: 7" 26# P-110

11/7/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| STIM 1 Completion
On 11/6/08 @ 7:00 AM finish POOH w/ RBP. PU & RIH w/ 2980' 2-3/8"
& 2-7/8" workstring. RIH to end of 4-1/2" liner @ 8707'. Pull up to
8560". RU acid crew, pump 4000 gals 15% HCL, flush w/ 47 bbls 2%
KCL. Pull up to 7900', pump 4000 gals 15% HCL, flush w/ 30 bbls 2%
KCL & 15 bbls 10# brine. Pull up to 7460', pump 4000 gals 15% HCL,
flush w/ 40 bbls 2% KCL, secure well, drain up lines. SDFN.
24 Hour Forecast: Finish acid job, lay down workstring. PU & RIH w/
production tbg.
Casing Size: 7" 26# P-110

11/8/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| STIM 1 Completion
On 11/7/08 @ 7:00 AM - O psi on tbg & csg, open well, pull up to 7020'".
RU acid crew, pump 4000 gals 15% HCL, flush w/ 30 bbls 2% KCL & 10
bbls 10# brine. Pull up to 6560', pump 4000 gals 15% HCL, flush 30
bbls 2% KCL & 10 bbls 10# brine. Pull up to 6030', pump 4000 gals
15% HCI, flush tbg w/ 30 bbls 2% KCL & 10 bblis 10# brine. RD acid
crew. POOH w/ workstring, laying down 2-7/8" tbg, 2-3/8" tbg & 3-3/4"
bit. SDFN @ 4:00 PM.
24 Hour Forecast: RIH w/ production tbg, swab back acid.
Casing Size: 7" 26# P-110

11/11/2008  106:00 - 16:00 10.00| BOP 1 Completion
On 11/10/08 @ 7:00 AM - PU, tally & rabbit in hole w/ 2-7/8" production
string. ND BOP's, set anchor, land tbg w/ #12000 tension. NU WH, RU
swab equipment. Made 11 swab runs, recovered 57 bbls fluid, no oil.
IFL @ 750, FFL @ 950", final Ph 6. SDFN @ 5:00 PM.
24 Hour Forecast: RIH swab back acid, run rods & pump.
Casing Size: 7" 26# P-110

11/12/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 Completion
On 11/11/08 @ 7:00 AM - Swab tbg, made 39 runs & recovered 212
bbls fluid. IFL @ 750'. FFL. @ 650'. Final Ph = 4. Started getting oil
shows after swabbing back 163 bbls, final oil cut 90+%. RD swab.
SDFN @ 4:00 PM.
24 Hour Forecast: Run rods & pump. RDMO.
Casing Size: 7" 26# P-110

Printed: 12/1/2008 10:27:23 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name:

WRU GB 14G-4-8-22

Common Well Name: WRU GB 14G-4-8-