
O O
FORM APPROVED

Fonn 31604 OMB NO.10404136
(Julyi992) UNITED STATES SUBMITINTRIPLICATE* Expkes:February28,1995

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NO.
BUREAU OF LANDMANAGEMENT UTU-10164

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN UTE TRIBE

TYPE OF WORK 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
DRILL U DEEPEN O NIA

TYPE OF WELL 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME,WELL NO.
O O SINGLE MULTIPLE

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE FR 6P-20-14-20
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR Contact: Jan Nelson 9.API NUMBER:

QUESTAR EXPLORATION& PRODUCTION, CO. E-Mail: jan.nelson@questar.com 'O
3. ADDRESS Telphone number 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

11002 East 17500 South Vernal, utah 84078 Phone 435-781-4331 Fax 435-781-4329 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*) 11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEY OR AREA

At Surface Gj[37) 2110' FNL 2059' FWL, SENW, Section 20, T14S, R20E
At proposed production'zone , ifŠ Í/7 ~

- SEC. 20, T14S, R20E Mer SLB
14. DISTANCEIN MILES FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POSTOFFICE* 12. COUNTYOR PARISH 13. STATE
51+ I - MILES FROM OURAY, UTAH UIntah UT
15. DISTANCEFROM PROPOSED LOCATIONTO NEAREST 16.NO.OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(also to nearest drig,unit line if any) 1760.00 40

2059' +I-

18.DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BLMIBIABond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, ft

12,350"
ESBOOOO24

2,360' +I-

21. ELEVATIONS(Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.) 22. DATEWORK WILLSTART 23. Estimated duration
7313.4' GR ASAP 20 Days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:
1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an exisiting bond on file (see
2. A DrillingPlan Item 20 above).
3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is on National Forest System Lands, 5. Operator certification.

the SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office) 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.

SIGNED Name (printedItyped) Jan Nelson DATE 12/03/2007

TITL Regulatory Affairs

(This space for Federal or State office use)

PERMIT NO. APPROVAL DATE
Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds any legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon

CONDITIONS APPROVAL IF ANY:

BRADLEYG. HILL
APPROVED BY % TITLE ENVIRONMENTALMANAGER

DATE - Ö
*See Instructions On Reverse Side

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfullyto maketo any de or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representa r it urisdiction

DECO5 2007
FederalApproval of this
Action Is Necessary DN.0FOIL,GAS&



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
T14S, R20 E, S. L.B. &M· Well location, FR #6P-20--14-20, located as shown

in the SE 1/4 NW 1/4 of Section 20, T14S, R20E,
NB871'53"E - 2595.32' (Meas SO9°19'58"E

- 2628.88' (Meas.) S.L.B.&M., Uintoh County, Utah.
Marked BASIS OF ELEVATION

searing Tree BENCH MARK (59 WF) LOCATED IN THE NW 1/4 OF SECTION 10,
T15S, R20E, S.L.B.&M., TAKEN FROM THE FLAT ROCK MESA
QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE SERIES
(TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP) PUBLISHEDBY THE UNITED STATES

.- DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID
ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 7449 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

FR f6P-20-14-20
2059. Elev. Ungraded Ground = 7317'

Set Marked N20 Stone

Section Corner
Re-Estab//shed by
Ðear/ng Tree
Information
(Not Set on Ground)

o o - o
-- to O

mm --

SCALE

I CERTIFIC guHiltyg
THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE AB FROM
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUALSURVE BY ME OR Y

o SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE S CO O THE
. BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND 1|E

IS E SUR OSet Marked Stone, Set Marked Set Marked ON NO. 1 19Pile of Stones nStone
A e

cean.
SNB9°26'45T

- 262J.74' (Meas.) NB9°32'097
- 2612.23' (Meas.)

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
LEGEND: 85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

=
90° SYMBOL (AUTONOMOUS NAD 83) (435) 789-1017

LATITUDE=
39°35'10.99" (39.586386) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LONGITUDE= 109°42'13.96" (109.703878) 1" = 1000' 07-23-07 07-31-07
= SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. (AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES

LATlTUDE=
39°35'11.12" (39.586422) J.W. Q.B. L.K. G.L.O. PLAT

= SECTION CORNERS RE-ESTABLISHED· LONGITUDE= 109°42'11.47" (109.703186) WEATHER FILE
(Not Set on Ground) WARM QUESTAR EXPLR. &



Additional Operator Remarks

Questar Explor. & Prod Co proposes to drill a wellto 12,350' to test the Wingate. If productive,
casing will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well willbe plugged and abandoned as per BLM
and State of Utah requirements"

Please see Onshore Oil & Gas Order NQ. 1

Please be advised that Questar Explor. & Prod Co agrees to be responsible under the terms and
conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for thiswell is provided by Bond No.ESBOOOO24 The principal is Questar Explor. &
Prod. Co. via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR



ONSHORE OIL & GASLER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
Flat Rock 6P-20-14-20

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation TVD MD Prod. Phase Anticipated
Green River Sfc Sfc
Wasatch 2355 2355
Mesa Verde 4348 4348 Gas
Castlegate 6376 6376
Mancos 7136 7136
Dakota Silt 10,725 10,725
Dakota 10,761 10,761 Gas
Cedar Mountain 10,896 10,896
Morrison 11,091 11,091
Curtis l1,643 11,643
Entrada l1,741 11,741 Gas
Carmel 12,059 12,059
Wingate 12,229 .12,229 Gas
TD 12,350 12,350

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas.
Or other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation TVD Depth MD Depth
Gas Mesaverde 4,348' 4,348'
Gas Dakota 10,761' 10,761'
Gas Entrada l1,741' l1,741'
Gas Wingate 12,229'



ONSHORE OIL & GAS RDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
Flat Rock 6P-20-14-20

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If no flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted.
Fresh water will be obtained from Willow Creek water right #49-2183 / Permit# T75500.

All waste water resulting from drilling operations will be disposed of at RNI disposal pit
located in NWNE Section 5, T9S, R22E.

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 5,000 psi W.P. Double Gate BOP or Single Gate BOP (schematic attached)

B. Functional test daily

C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psi/foot or 1500 psi, or 70 % of
burst whichever is greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure
shall not exceed the internal yield pressure of the casing.

D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 5M system and individual components shall
be operable as designed.

4. Casing Program
Depth Hole Size Cse Size Type Weight

Surface 500' 14-3/4" 10-3/4" J-55 40.51b/ft (new)
Intermediate 3800' 9-7/8" 7 5/8" P-110 29.71b/ft (new)
Production TD 6 ½" 4 ½" P-110



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
Flat Rock 6P-20-14-20
5. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - no

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Rotating Head - yes
If drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling
below 500').

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will
be used. It is not intended to use oil in the mud, however, in the event it is used, oil
concentration will be less than 4% by volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 9.5
ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

6. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores - none anticipated

B. DST - none



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
Flat Rock 6P-20-14-20

Logging - Mud logging - 3600 to TD
GR-SP-Induction
Neutron Density
FMI

C. Formation and Completion Interval: Wingate interval, final
determination of completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation - Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

7. Cementing Program

See attached Cementing Recommendation.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and
across zones as required by the authorized officer to insure protection of natural
resources.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 5522 psi. Maximum
anticipated bottom hole temperature is 220° F.

9. Surface Owner
The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by the Ute



O O

BOP Requirements:

Rotating Head

I I

13-5/8" 10M Annular

I I

13-5/8" 10M Double Ram

13-5/8" 10M Mud Cross

2" KillLine 3" Choke Line

13-5/8" 10M Single Ram

¯¯

Mat Board | Mat Board

11" 10M x 13-5/8" 10M spacer spool

11" 5M x 11" 10M Multi-Bowl "B" Sect

10-3/4" x

1'ds5UM

"A" Section
QEP / Wexpro

10-3/4" 40.5 # J-55
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Flat Rock 6P-20-14-20

20" Conductor CSA 80'

10-3/4" 40.5 # CSA 500'

Wasatch 2355.00

7-5/8" 29.7 # PA10 CSA +I 3800'

Mesaverde 4348.00

Castlegate 6376.00

Mancos 7136.00

Dakota Silt 10725.00
Dakota 10761.00
Cedar Mountain 10896.00
Morrison 11091.00
Curtis 11643.00
Entrada 11741.00
Carmel ¼059.00
Wingate 12229.00

13.5 # P-110 CSA
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GEP E-bill
1050 17th Street, Ste 500-do Not Ma
Denver, Colorado 80265

FR 6P-20-14-20
Flat Rock Field
Uintah County, Utah
United States of America

Multi-String Cementing
Recommendation
Prepared for: Mr. Jim Davidson
Office Number: 303-308-3090
November 19, 2007
Version: 146982-1

Submitted by:
Aaron James
Halliburton
1125 17th St Suite 1900
Denver, Colorado 80202 HALLIBURTON
303-899-4717

Proposal FR 6P -20-14-20



HALLIBUR N

Halliburton appreciates the opportunity to present
this proposal and looks forward to being of service to you.

Foreword

Enclosed is our recommended procedure for cementing the casing strings in the referenced well.
The information in this proposal includes well data, calculations, materials requirements, and cost
estimates. This proposal is based on information from our field personnel and previous cementing
services in the area.

Halliburton Energy Services recognizes the importance of meeting society's needs for health,
safety, and protection of the environment. It is our intention to proactively work with employees,
customers, the public, governments, and others to use natural resources in an environmentally sound
manner while protecting the health, safety, and environmental processes while supplying high quality
products and services to our customers.

We appreciate the opportunity to present this proposal for your consideration and we look
forward to being of service to you. Our Services for your well will be coordinated throughthe Service
Center listed below. If you require any additional information or additional designs, please feel free to
contact myself or our field representative listed below.

Remember the Basics of Cementing:
-Annular Energy -Mud Properties (PV, YP, FL, GS)
-Spacers / Flushes -Pipe Centralization
-Plug System -Communication

Prepared by:
Sally Kroger
Procedure Analyst

Submitted by:
Aaron James
Technical Advisor

SERVICE CENTER: Vernal. UT
SERVICE COORDINATOR: Corey Reynolds
CEMENT ENGINEERS: Chris Cicirello

Tyler Anderson
Sean Jones

PHONE NUMBER: 435-789-2550

2
QEP E-BILL FR



HALLIBURTDM

Cementing Best Practices

1. Cement quality and weight: You must choose a cement slurry that is designed to solve the problems
specific to each casing string.

2. Waiting time: You must hold the cement slurry in place and under pressure until it reaches its' initial set
without disturbing it. A cement slurry is a time-dependent liquid and must be allowed to undergo a hydration
reactiorito producea competent cement sheath. A fresh cement slurry can be worked (thickening or pump time) as
long as it is in a plastic state and before going through its' transition phase. If the cement slurry is not allowed to
transition without being disturbed, it may be subjected to changes in density, dilation, settling, water separation, and
gas cutting that may lead to a lack of zonal isolation and possible bridging in the annulus.

3. Pipe movement: Pipe movement may be one of the single most influential factors in mud removal.
Reciprocation and/or rotation mechanically breaks up gelled mud and changes thè flow patterns in the annulus to
improve displacement efficiency.

4. Mud properties (for cementing):
Rheology:

Plastic Viscosity (PV) < 15 centipoise (cp)
Yield Point (YP) < 10 lb/100 ft2
These properties should be reviewed with the Mud Engineer, Drilling Engineer, and Company
Representative(s) to ensure no hole problenis are created.

Gel Strength:
The 10-second/10-minutegel strength values should be such that the 10-second and 10-minute readings

are close together or flat (i.e., 5/6) The 30-minute reading should be less than 20 lb/100 ft2.Sufficient shear stress
may not be achieved on a primary cement job to remove mud left in the hole if the mud were to develop
more than 25 lb/100 ft2of gel strength.
Fluid Loss:

Decreasing the filtrate loss into a permeable zone enhances the creation of a thin, competent filter cake. A
thin, competent filter cake created by a low fluid loss mud system is desirable over a thick, partially gelled filter
cake. A mud system created with a low fluid loss will be more easily displaced The fluid loss value should be <
15 cc's (îdealwould be 5 cc's).

5. Circulation: Prior to cementing circulate full hole volume twice, or until weß conditioned mud is being
returned to the surface. There should be no cutting in the mud returns. An annular velocity of 260 foet per minute
is optimum (SPE/IADC 186171 ifpossible.

6. Flow rate: Turbulent flow is the most desirable flow regime for mud removal. If turbulence cannot be
achieved pump at as high a flow rate that can practically and safely be used to create the maximum flow energy.
The highest mud removal is achieved when the maxnnum flow energy is obtained.

7. Pipe Centralization: The Cement will take the path of least resistance, therefore propercentralization is
important to help prevent the casing from contacting the borehole wall. A minimum standoff of 70% should be
targeted for optimum displacement efficiency.

8. Rat hole: A weighted viscous pill placed in the rat hole prior to cementing will minimize the risk of higher
density cement mixing with lower density mud when the well is static.

9. Top and Bottom plugs: A top and bottom plug are recommended to be run on all primary casing jobs. The
bottom plug should be run after the spacer and ahead of the first cement sturry.

10 Spacers and flushes: Spacers and/or flushes should be uàd to prevent contamination between the cement
slurry and the drilling fluid. They are aÏsoused to clean the wellbore and aid with bonding. To determine the
volume, either a minimum of 10 minutes contact time or 1000 ft. of annular fill, whichever is greater, is
recommended.

3
QEP E-BIIL IfR



HALLIBUR N

Job Information Surface Casing

FR 6P-20-14-20

14-3/4" Surface Open Hole 0 - 500 ft (MD)
0 - 500 ft (TVD)

Inner Diameter 14.750 in
Job Excess 100 %

10-3/4" Surface Casing 0 - 500 ft (MD)
0 - 500 ft (TVD)

Outer Diameter 10.750 in
Inner Diameter 10.050 in
Linear Weight 40.50 lbm/ft
Casing Grade J-55

Mud Type Air

4
QEP E-BILL FR



HALLIBURTON

Calculations Surf aceCasing

Spacer:
Total Spacer = 112.29 fŸ

= 20.00 bbl

Cement : (500.00 ft fill)
5Ú0.00ft * 0.5563 ff/ft * 100 % 556.32 ft'
Total Primary Cement = 556.32 ft3

99.09 bbl
Sacks of Cement = 321 sks

Shoe Joint Volume: (42.00 ft fill)
42.00 ft * 0.5509 fŸ/ft = 23.14 ft"

= 4.12 bbl
Tail plus shoe joint 579.46 ft3

= 103.21bbl

Total Pipe Capacity:
500.00 ft * 0.5509 ft'/ft = 275.44 ft"

= 49.06 bbl

Displacement Volume to Shoe Joint .
Capacity of Pipe - Shoe Joínt = 49.06 bbl - 4.12 bbl

44.94 bbl

QEP E-BILL FR



HALLIBUR N

Job Recommendation Surface Casing
.

Fluid Instructions
Fluid 1: Water Based Spacer
Gel Water Fluid Density: 8.34 lbm/gal

Fluid Volume: 20 bbl

Fluid 2: Primary Cement
VARICEM CEMENT Fluid Weight 13.50 lbm/gal

0.3 % D-AIR 3000 (Additive Material) Slurry Yield: 1.80 ft*/sk
0.25 lbm/sk Kwik Seal (Lost Circulation Additive) Total Mixing Fluid: 9.34 Gallsk
0.125 lbm/sk Poly-E-Flake (Lost Circulation Additive) Top of Fluid: 0 ft

Calculated Fill: 500 ft
Volume: 103.21 bbl

Calculated Sacks: 321.21 sks
Proposed Sacks: 325 sks

Fluid 3: Water Spacer
Water Displacement Fluid Density: 8.34 lbm/gal

Fluid Volume: 44.94 bbl

Fluid 4: Top Out Cement
Premium Plus - Type III Fluid Weight 14.50 lbm/gal

94 lbm/sk Premium Plus - Type III (Cement-api) Slurry Yield: 1.41 ft3/Sk

2 % Calcium Chloride (Accelerator) Total Mixing Fluid: 6.86 Gallsk
Proposed Sacks: 200 sks

6
QEP E-BILL FR



HALLIBUNTOIW

Job Procedure Surface Casing

Detailed Pumping Schedule
Fluid # Fluid Fluid Name Surface Estimated Downhole

Type Density Avg Rate Volume
Ibm/gal bbl/min

1 Spacer Gel Water 8.3 5.0 20 bbl

2 Cement VariCem V1 13.5 5.0 325 sks

3 Spacer Water Displacement 8.3 5 0 44.¾ bbl

4 Cement Top Out Cement 14.5 1.5 200 sks

7
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HALLIBUR ON

Job Information Intermediate Casing

FR 6P-20-14-20

10-3/4" Surface Casing 0 - 500 ft (MD)
0 - 500 ft (TVD)

Outer Diameter 10.750 in
Inner Diameter 10.050 in
Linear Weight 40.50 lbm/ft
Casing Grade J-55

9-7/8" Intermediate Open Hole 500 - 3800 ft (MD)
Inner Diameter 9.875 in
Job Excess 50 %

7-5/8" Intermediate Casing 0 - 3800 ft (MD)
Outer Diameter 7.625 in
Inner Diameter 6.875 in
Linear Weight 29.70 lbm/ft
Casing Grade P-110

Mud Type Aerated
Mud Weight 8.40 lbm/gal
BHCT 95 degF

10
QEP E-BILL FR



HALLIBUR ON

Calculations IntermediateCasing

Spacer:
Total Spacer = 56.15 ft3

= 10.00 bbl

Spacer:
Total Spacer = 112.29 ft"

= 20.00 bbl

Spacer:
Total Spacer = 56.15 ft"

= 10.00 bbl

Cement : (2200.00 ft fill)
500.00 ft * 0.2338 ft3/ft * 0 % = 116.89 R3
1700.00 ft * 0.2148 ft*/ft * 50 % = 547.63 R3
Total Foamed Lead Cement = 664.52 ft"

= 118.36bbl
Sacks of Cement = 264 sks

Cement : (1100.00 ft fill)
1100.00 ft * 0.2148 ft*/ft * 50 % = 354.35 R3
Total Foamed Lead Cement = 354.35 ft"

= 63.11 bbl
Sacks of Cement = 182 sks

Cement : (500.00 ft fill)
500.00 ft * 0.2148 ft*/ft * 50 % = 161.07 ft"
Tail Cement = 161.07 ft3

= 28.69 bbl

Shoe Joint Volume: (42.00 ft fill)
42.00 ft * 0.2578 ft'/ft = 10.83ft3

= 1.93 bbl
Tail plus shoe joint = 171.90ft3

= 30.62 bbl
Total Tail = 117 sks

Total Pipe Capacity:
3800.00 ft * 0.2578 ft*/ft

= 979.62 ft"
= 174.48bbl

Displacement Volume to Shoe Joint:
Capacity of Pipe - Shoe Joint = 174.48bbl - 1.93 bbl

= 172.55bbl

11
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HALLIBUR ON

Job Recommendation Intermediate Casing

Fluid Instructions
Fluid li Water Spacer
Fresh Water Ahead Fluid Density: 8.34 lbm/gal

Fluid Volume: 10 bbl

Fluid 2: Reactive Spacer
Super Flush Fluid Density: 9.20 lbm/gal

50 lbm/bbl Halliburton Super Flusli(Flush/spacer Additive)Fluid Volume: 20 bbl
42 lbm/bbl Fresh Water (Base Fluid)

Fluid 3: Water Spacer
Fresh Water Behind Fluid Density: 8.34 lbm/gal

Fluid Volume: 10 bbl

Fluid 4: Foamed Lead Cement
ELASTISEAL SYSTEM Fluid Weight 14.30 lbm/gal

1.5 % FDP-C760-04 (Fdp Additive) Slurry Yield: 1A7ft*/sk
Total Mixing Fluid: 6.41 Gal/sk

Top of Fluid: 0 ft
Calculated Fill: 2200 ft

Volume: 118.36 bbl
Calculated Sacks: 263.56 sks

Proposed Sacks: 265 sks

Fluid 5; Foamed Lead Cement
ELASTISEAL SYSTEM Fluid Weight 14.30 lbm/gal

1.5 % FDP-C760-04 (Fdp Additive) Slurry Yield: 1 47 ft9sk
Total Mixing Fluid: 6.41 Gal/sk .

Top of Fluid: 2200 ft
Calculated Fill: 1100Ît

Volume: 63.11 bbl
Calculated Sacks: 181 79 sks

Proposed Sacks: 185 sks

Fluid 6: Tail Cement
ELASTISEAL SYSTEM Fluid Weight 14.30 lbm/gal

Slurry Yield: 1.47 R3/Sk

Total Mixing Fluid: 6.40 Gallsk
Top of Fluid: 3300 ft

CalculatedFill: 500 ft
Volume: 30.62 bbl

Calculated Sacks 117.02 sks

12
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HALLIBURTON
Proposed Sacks: 120 sks

Fluid 7: Water Spacer
Displacement Fluid Density: 8.34 lbm/gal

Fluid Volume: 307.70 bbl

Fluid 8: Top Out Cement
Premium Cement Fluid Weight 14.60 lbm/gal

94 lbm/sk Premium Cement (Cement) Slurry Yield: 1.55 ft'/sk
12 % Cal-Seal 60 (Accelerator) Total Mixing Fluid: 7 35 Gallsk
3 % Calcium Chloride (Accelerator) Proposed Sacks 200 sks

13
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HALLIBURTOIV

Job Procedure Intermediate Casing

Detailed Pumping Schedule
Fluid # Fluid Fluid Name Surface Estimated Dowñhole

Type Densitÿ Avg Rate Volume
lbm/gal bblimin

1 Spacer Fresh Water Ahead 8.3 5.0 10 bbl
2 Spacer Super Flush 9.2 5.0 20 bbl
3 Spacer Fresh Water Behind 8.3 5.0 10 bbl
4 Cement 8.5 ppg Foamed Elastiseal 14.3 5.0 265 sks

5 Cement 11 ppg Foamed Elastiseal 14.3 5.0 185 sks

6 Cement Unfoamed Elastiseal 14.3 5.0 120 sks

7 Spacer Displacement 8.3 7.0 307.70 bbl
8 Cement Cap Cement 14.6 1.5 200 sks

Foam Output Parameter Summary:
Pluid# Fluid Name Unfoame Beginning Ending Beginning Ending

d Liquid Density Density Rate Rate
Volume Ibm/gal lbm/gal scf/bbl scf/bbl

Stage 1

4 8.5 ppg Foamed Elastiseal 69.01bbl 8.5 8.5 23.3 287.8
5 11 ppg Foamed Elastiseal 47.60bbi 11.0 11.0 124.7 202.0

Foam Design Specifications:
Foam Calculation Method: Constant Density Calculated Gas = 18737.4 sof

Backpressure: 75 psig Additional Gas = 40000 scf
Bottom Hole Circulating Temp: 95 degF Total Gas = 58737.4 sef

Mud Outlet Temperature: 80 degF

14
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HALLIBUR ON

Job information Production Casing

FR 6P-20-14-20

10-3/4" Surface Casing 0 - 500 ft (MD)
o- 500 ft (TVD)

Outer Diameter 10.750 in
Inner Diameter 10.050 in
Linear Weight 40.50 lbm/ft
Casing Grade J-55

7-5/8" Intermediate Casing 0 - 3800 ft (MD)
Outer Diameter 7.625 in
Inner Diameter 6 875 in
Linear Weight 29.70 lbm/ft
Casing Grade P-110

6-1/2" Production Open Hole 38û0 - 12350 ft (MD)
Intier Diameter 6.500 in
Job Excess 40 %

4-1/2" Production Casing 0 - 12350 ft (MD)
Outer Diameter 4.500 in
Inner Diameter 3.920 in
Linear Weight 13.50 lbm/ft
Casing Grade P-110

Mud Type Water Based Mud
Mud Weight 9.50 lbm/gal
BHCT 180 degF

18
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HALLIBURTON

Job Recommendation Production Casing

Fluid Instructions
Fluid 1 Water Spacer
Fresh Water Ahead Fluid Density: 8.34 lbm/gal

Fluid Volume: 10 bbl

Fluid 2: Reactive Spacer
Super Flush Fluid Density: 9.20 lbm/gal

Fluid Volume: 20 bbi

Fluid 3: Water Spacer
Fresh Water Behind Fluid Density: 8.34 lbm/gal

Fluid Volume: 10 bbl

Fluid 4: Foamed Lead Cement
ELASTISEAL SYSTEM Fluid Weight 14.30 lbm/gal

1.5 % FDP-C760-04 (Fdp Additive) Slurry Yield: 1.47 ft'/sk
Total Mixing Fluid: 6.41 Gallsk

Top of Fluid: 3000 ft
Calculated Fill: 8850 ft

Volume: 261.85 bbl
Calculated Sacks: 730.62 sks

Proposed Sacks: 735 sks

Fluid 5: Tail Cement
ELASTISEAL SYSTEM Fluid Weight 14.30 lbm/gal

Slurry Yield: 1 47 ft3
Total Mixing Fluid: 6.40 Gal/sk

Top of Fluid: 11850 ft
Calculated Fill: 500 ft

Volume: 15.59 bbl
Calculated Sacks: 59.57 sks

Proposed Sacks: 60 sks

Fluid 6: Water Spacer
Displacement Fluid Density: 8 34 lbm/gal

Fluid Volume: 183.72 bbl

Fluid 7: Top Out Cement
Premium Cement Fluid Weight 14.60 lbm/gal

94 lbm/sk Premium Cement (Cement) Slurry Yield: 1.55 ft'/sk
12 % Cal-Seal 60 (Accelerator) Total Mixing Fluid: 7.35 Galisk
3 % Calcium Chloride (Accelerator) Proposed Sacks: 75 sks

20
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HALLIBURTON

Job Procedure Production Casing

Detailed Pumping Schedule
Fluid # Fluid Fluid Name Surface Estimated Downhole

Type Density Avg Rate Volume
Ibm/gal bbl/min

1 Spacer Fresh Water Ahead 8.3 5.0 10 bbl

2 Spacer Super Flush 9.2 5.0 20 bbl
3 Spacer 14esh Water Behind 8.3 5.0 10 bbl
4 Cement Elastiseal Foamed Lead 14 3 5.0 735 sks

5 Cement Elastiseal Unfoamed Tail 14.3 5.0 60 sks

6 Spacer Displacement 8 3 7.0 183.72 bbl

7 Cement 12/3 Thixo 14.6 1.5 75 sks

Foam Output Parameter Summary:
Fluid # Fluid Name Unfoame Beginning Ending Beginning Ending

d Liquid Density Density Rate Rate
Volume lbm/gal lbm/gal scf/bbl scf/bbl

Stage 1

4 Elastiseal Foamed Lead 191.29bb 11 0 11.0 164.5 674.4
1

Foam Design Specifications:
Foam Calculation Method: Constant Density Calculated Gas = 82635.6 scf

Backpressure: 75 psig Additional Gas = 40000 sef
Bottom Hole Circulating Temp: 180 degF Total Gas = 122635.6 scf

Mud Outlet Temperature: 120 degF
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HALLIBURTON

Conditions

NOTE

In order to meet your needs under this Agreement (Proposal) with a high quality of service and
responsive timing, Halliburton will be allocating limited resources and committing valuable equipment
and materials to your area of operations. Accordingly, the discounts reflected in this Agreement
(Proposal) are available only for products and services awarded on a first-call basis. As set forth below,
alternate pricing will apply in the event that Halliburton is awarded work on any basis other than as a
first-call provider.

The unit prices stated in the proposal are based on our current published prices. The projected equipment,
personnel, and material needs are only estimates based on information about the work presently available
to us. At the time the work is actually performed, conditions then existing may require an increase or
decreasein the equipment, personnel, and/or material needs. Charges will be based upon unit prices in
effect at the time the workis performed and the amount of equipment, personnel, and/or material actually
utilized in the work Taxes, if any, are not included. Applicable taxes, if any, will be added to the actual
invoice.

It is understood and agreed between the parties that with the exception of the subject discounts, all
services performed and equipment and materials sold are provided subject to Halliburton's General Terms
and Conditionscontained in our current price list,(whichincludeLIMITATION OF LIABILITY and
WARRANTY provisions), and pursuant to the applicable Halliburton Work Order Contract (whether or
not executed bý you), unless a Master Service and/or Sales Contract applicable to the services, equipment,
or materials supplied exists between your company and Halliburton, in which case the negotiated Master
Contract shall govern the relationship between the parties. A copy of the latest version of our General
Terms and Conditions is available from your Halliburton representative or at
httpU/www.halliburton.com/hes/general_termsconditions.pdf for your convenient review, and we would
appreciate receiving any questions you may have about them. Sliould your company be interested in
negotiating a Master Contract with Halliburton, our Law Department would be pleased to work with you
to finalize a mutually agreeable contract. In this connection, it is also understood and agreed that
Customer will continueto execute Halliburton usual field work orders and/or tickets customarilyrequired
by Halliburton in connection with the furnishing of said services, equipment, and materials.
Any terms and conditions contained in purchase orders or other documents issued by the customer shall
be of no effect except to confirm the type and quantity of services, equipment, and materials to be
supplied to the customer.
If customer does not have an approved open account.witlr Halliburton or a mutually executed written
contract with Halliburton, which dictates payment terms different than those set forth in this clause, all
sums due are payable in cash at the time of performance of services or delivery of equipment, products, or
materials. If eustomer has an approved operraccount, invoices are payable on the twentieth day after date
of invoice.

Customer agrees to pay interest on any unpaid balancefrom the date payable until paid at the highest
lawful contract rate applicable; but never to exceed 18% per annum. In the event Halliburton employs an
attorney for collection of any account, customer agrees to pay attorney fees of20% of the unpaid account,
plus all collection and court costs.

25
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QUESTAR EXPLORATION& PRODUCTION, CO.
FR 6P-20-14-20

2110' FNL 2059' FWL
SENW, SECTION 20, T14S, R20E

UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-10164

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI- POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

1. Existinq Roads:

The proposed wellsite is approximately 51 miles from Ouray, Utah.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 - mile radius.

2. Planned Access Roads:

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 - Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.

4. Location of Existinq & Proposed Facilities:

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of theproposed pipeline.

5. Location and Type of Water Supply:

Fresh water for drillingpurposes willbe obtained from WillowCreek water #49-2183/ Permit# T75500.

6. Source of Construction Materials:

Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area willbe utilized. Any gravel willbe obtained
from a commercial source. The use of materialsunder BLMjurisdictionwillconform with 43 CFR
3610.2-3.

7. Methods of Handlinq Waste Materials:

Drillcuttings willbe contained and buried in the reserve pit. Drillingfluids, including salts and
chemicals, willbe contained in the reserve pit. Upon terminationof drillingand completion
operations, the liquid contents of the reserve pit willbe used at the next drillsite or willbe removed
and disposed of at an approvedwaste disposal facilitywith 120 days after drilling is terminated.
Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons in thepit shall be removed in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

After first production, produced wastewater willbe confined to the approved pit or storage tank for
a period not to exceed 90 days. During the 90 day period, in accordance with Onshore Order #7,
all produced waterwillbe contained in tanks on location and then hauled to Wonsits Valley location
in SWNW section 12, T8S, R21E; or Red Wash Disposal Well located in NESW, Section 28, T7S, R22E;
or, Red Wash Central Battery Disposal located in SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E. Pit reclamation
for lined pit willbe ruptured when emptied to allow the remaining liquid to be adequately mixed and to
promote additional drying of the pit
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8. Ancillary Facilities:

None anticipated.

9. Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drillpad cross-sections, cuts and fills
and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailerparking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram todescribe rig orientation, parking areas, and access
roads.

A Pit liner is required felt if rock encountered.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Topsoil willbe stripped and salvaged to provide for sufficient quantities to be respread to a depth
of at least 4 to 6 inches over the disturbed areas to be reclaimed. Topsoil shall be stock piled separately
from subsoil materials. Topsoil salvaged from the reserve pit shall be stockpiled separately near the
reserve pit. Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area willbe cleared of
all unused tubing,materials, trash, and debris not required for production. Alternatively, the pit will
be pumped dry, the liner folded into thepit, and the pit backfilled. The reserve pit willbe reclaimed
within 120 days from the date of well completion, weather permitting.

Seed mix# 1

11. Surface Ownership:

The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by:

Ute Tribe
P.O. Box 70
Fort Duchesne, UT 84026

12. Other Information:

A Class IIIarchaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology
Consultants. A copy of this report was submitted directly totheappropriateagencies by
Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended
for this
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Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

Jan Nelson
Red Wash Rep.

Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4331

Certification:

AIIlease and/or unitoperations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made withall applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved

plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

QEP willbe fully responsible for the actions of theirsubcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drillwill be furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all

construction and drilling operations.

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access route; that I am familiar withthe conditionswhich currently
exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and

correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by QEP it's contractors and subcontractors

in conformitywith thisplan and the termsand conditions under which it is approved. This
statement is subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

03-Dec-07
Jan Nelson Date

Red Wash
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TYPICALCROSS SECTIONSFOR
X-Section

scale FR #6P-20-14-20
SECTION 20, T14S, R20E, S.L.B.&M.

1" = 100' 2110' FNL 2059' FWL Eg 4x
DATE: 07-31-07 4 4
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NOTE: ACCESS ROAD O/S7URBANCE = ± 0.395 ACRES 5% FOR COMPACT/0N
.

ITopsoil should not be P/PEL/NE D/STURBANCE = ± 0.566 ACRES
Stripped Below Finished
Grade on Substructure Area. TOTAL= ± 4.137 ACRES
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(12") Topsoil Stripping = 4,770 Cu. Yds.
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I.IINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
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PROPOSED ACCESS 0.1 Mt. +/-

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying
85 South 200 East VernaI, Utah 84078

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
WWWWEEMM
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Uiutah Engineering & Land Surveying
85 Soum 200 East Veirnal, Utah $4078

(435) 789-10 57 * FAX (435) 789-1813
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PROPOSED LOCATION:
FR #6P-20-14-20

e

7/79

APPROXIMATE TOTAL PIPELINE DISTANCE = 822' /-
LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD N FR #6P-20-14-20
~¯¯¯¯¯¯¯¯¯¯

SECTION 20, T14S, R20E, S.L.B.&M.
----------- (SERVICING UFHER WELLS) 2110' FNL 2059' FWL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 08 0 1 07
85 South 200 East VernaE, Utah 84O"TS M A P MONTH DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1" = 10001 DRAWNBY:C.P. REVISED:



WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 12/05/2007 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-39809

WELL NAME: FR 6P-20-14-20

OPERATOR: QUESTAR EXPLORATION & ( N5085 ) PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4331

CONTACT: JAN NELSON

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SENW 20 140S 200E . .Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 2110 FNL 2059 FWL
BOTTOM: 2110 FNL 2059 FWL Engineering

COUNTY: UINTAH
Geology

LATITUDE: 39.58612 LONGITUDE: -109.7031

UTM SURF EASTINGS:611373 NORTHINGS: 4382416 Surface

FIELD NAME: UNDESIGNATED ( 2 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-10164 PROPOSED FORMATION: WINGT

SURFACE OWNER: 2 - Indian COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

w/' Plat R649-2-3.

L,7 Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit:

(No. ESB000024 )
Potash (Y/N)

-/* R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 49-2183 )
Drilling Unit

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:(Date: )
Eff Date:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

NA' Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:
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FLAT ROCK
3-29-0-20

UtE TR[BA1

FLAT ROCK FIELD is2o

OPERATOR: QUESTAR EXPL &cPROD (N5085)
UTA H

SEC: 20,21 T.14S R. 20E DNR
FIELD: UNDESIGNATED (002)

COUNTY: UINTAH
Wells Status

SPACING: R649-3-2 / GENERAL SITING GAS INJECTION
y GAS STORAGE OIL, GAS & MINING
x LOCATION ABANDONED

NEW LOCATlON NField Status Unit Status PLUGGED & ABANDONED
ABANDONED EXPLORATORY PRODUCING GAS
ACTIVE GAS STORAGE PRODUCING OILNF PP OIL SHUT-IN GASCOMBINED NF SECONDARY

• SHUT-lN Oll. W E
INACTIVE P DING

p( TEMP. ABANDONED

TED G HERML A A N ECTION S
PP OIL g WATER SUPPLY PREPARED BY: DIANA MASON
SECONDARY WATER DISPOSAL DATE: 07-DECEMBER-2007
TERMINATED



stateGUtah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
ExecutiveDirector

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
DIVÎSion of Oil Gas and Mining

Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

December 17, 2007

QuestarExploration & Production, Co.
l1002 E 17500 S
Vernal, UT 84078

Re: FR 6P-20-14-20 Well, 2110' FNL, 2059' FWL, SE NW, Sec. 20, T. 14 South, R. 20 East,
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-39809.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal Office

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &



Operator: QuestarExploration & Production,Co.
Well Name & Number FR 6Pe20:14-20
API Number: 43,04¾39809
Lease: UTUs10164

Location: SE NW Sec._2_0_ T. MSouth R. 20 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.

• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to cornmencing operations to plug and abandon the welL
• Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281 office (801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form {Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an ordei of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data geneiated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing uruts in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the



FORM APPROVED
Form 31604 OMB NO. 10404136
(JulyiS92) UNITED STATES SUB TRIPLCATE Expires:February28,1995

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NO.
BUREAU OF LANDMANAGEMENT UTU-10164

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN UTE TRIBE

TYPE OF WORK 7. UNITAGREEMENf NAME
DRILL U DEEPEN NIA

TYPE OF WELL 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME,WELL NO.
O SINGLE MULTIPLE

O
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE FR 6P-20-14-20
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR Contact: Jan Nelson 9.API NUMBER:

QUESTAR EXPLORATION& PRODUCTION,CO. E-Mail: Jan.nelson@questar.com
3. ADDRESS Telphone number 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

11002 East 17500 South Vernal, utah 84078 Phone 435-781-4331 Fax 435-781-4329 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*) 11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEY OR AREA

At Surface 2110' FNL 2059' FWL, SENW, Section 20, T14S, R20E
At proposed production zone SEC. 20, Ti4S, R20E Mer SLB

14. DISTANCE IN MILES FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POSTOFFICE* 12. COUNTYOR PARISH 13. STATE
51+ / - MILES FROM OURAY, UTAH Uintah UT
15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATIONTO NEAREST 16.NO.OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(also to nearest drig,unit line if any) 1760.00 40

2059' +/-

18.DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BLMIBIABond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, ft

12,350"
ESBOOOO24

2,360' +I-

21. ELEVATIONS(Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.) 22. DATE WORK WILL START 23. Estimated duration
7313.4' GR ASAP 20 Days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:
1. Well plat certifiedby a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an exisitingbond on file (see
2. A DrillingPlan

item 20 above).
3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is on National Forest System Lands' 5. Operator certification.

the SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specificinformation and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.

SIGNED Name (printed/typed) Jan Nelson DATE 12/03/2007

TITLE egulatory Affairs

(This space for Federal or State office use}

PERMIT NO. APPROVAL DATE

APR2 1 20úðApplication approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds any legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING
APPROVED BY TITLE DATE //-/¢rp

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and winfully to make to any department or agency of the

NOTICEOF
APPROVALUnitedSta n s t s ud t so eeknta o i d



UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: Questar Exploration & Production Co. Location: SENW, Sec 20, T14S, R20E
Well No: FR 6P-20-14-20 Lease No: UTU-10164
API No: 43-047-39809 Agreement: N/A

Title Name Office Phone Number Cell Phone Number
Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker (435) 781-4490 (435) 828-4470
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee (435) 781-4432 (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer: James Ashley (435) 781-4470 (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer: Ryan Angus (435) 781-4430 (435) 828-7368
Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger (435) 781-4502 (435) 828-3913
NRS/Enviro Scientist: (435) 781-4475 (435) 828-4029
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Karl Wright (435) 781-4484 (435) 828-7381
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Holly Villa (435) 781-4404 (435) 828-3544
NRS/Enviro Scientist: (435) 781-4476
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Chuck Macdonald (435) 781-4441 (435) 828-7482
NRS/Enviro Scientist: (435) 781-3400 (435) 828-3544
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Michael Cutler (435) 781-3401 (435) 828-3546
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Anna Figueroa (435) 781-3407 (435) 828-3548
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Verlyn Pindell (435) 781-3402 (435) 828-3547
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Darren Williams (435) 781-4447 (435) 828-4029
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Nathan Packer (435) 781-3405 (435) 828-3545

Fax: (435) 781-3420

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with the
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill including
Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion
operations. This permit is approved for a two (2) year period, or until lease expiration, whichever occurs
first. An additional extension, up to two (2) years, may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS
Construction Activity - The Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Dept. shall be notified in writing 48

hours in advance of any construction activity. The Ute Tribal office is
open Monday throughThursday.

Construction Completion - Upon completion of the pertinent APDIROW construction, notify the
Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Dept. for a Tribal Technician to verify the
Affidavit of Completion.

Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(NotifgPeto eum j¯ngineer
Casing String &Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and cementing all
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.)___ casing_strings.
BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
(NotiftSupv. Petrole_umTech.)
First Production Notice Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or production
(Notify Petroleum Engineer) resumes after well has been off production for more than ninety
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SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

Surface COAs:

• Ifthere is an active Gilsonite mining operation within 2 miles of the well location, operator shall notifythe
Gilsonite operator at least 48 hours prior to any blasting during construction.

• If paleontological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop work
and contact the Authorized Officer (AO). A determination willbe made by the AO as to what mitigation
may be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material before construction can continue.

Additional Stipulations:

• A 1056 by 30' foot corridor right-of-way shall be approved. Upon completion of each pipeline in corridor,
they shall be identified and filed with the Ute Tribe.

• A qualified Archaeologist accompanied by a Tribal Technician willmonitor trenchingconstruction of
pipeline.

• The Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Department is to be notified, in writing 48 hours prior to construction of
pipeline.

• Construction Notice shall be given to the department on the Ute Tribe workdays, which are Monday
throughThursday. The Company understands that they may be responsible for costs incurred by the
Ute Tribe after hours.

• The Company shall inform contractors to maintain construction of pipelines within the approved ROWs.

• The Company shall assure the Ute Tribe that "ALLCONTRACTORS, INCLUDINGSUB-
CONTRACTORS, LEASINGCONTRACTORS, AND ETC." have acquired a current and valid Ute Tribal
Business License and have "Access Permits" prior to construction, and willhave these permits in all
vehicles at all times.

• You are hereby notified that working under the "umbrella"of a company does not allow you to be in the
field, and can be subject to those fines of the Ute Tribe Severance Tax Ordinance.

• Any deviation of submitted APD's and ROW applications the Companies will notifythe Ute Tribe and BIA
in writing and willreceive written authorization of any such change with appropriate authorization.

• The Company will implement "Safety and Emergency Plan". The Company's safety director will ensure
its compliance.

• AllCompany employees and/or authorized personnel (sub-contractors) in the field will have approved
applicable APDs and/or ROW permitslauthorizations on their person(s) during all phases of construction.

• AIIvehicular traffic,personnel movement, construction/restoration operations shall be confined to the
area examined and approved, and to the existing roadways and/or evaluated access routes.

• AIIpersonnel shall refrain from collecting artifacts, any paleontological fossils, and from disturbing any
significant cultural resources in the
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• The personnel from the Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Department shall be notified should cultural
remains from subsurface deposits be exposed or identified during construction. AIIconstruction will
cease.

• Allmitigative stipulations contained in the Bureau of Indian Affairs Site Specific Environmental
Assessment (EA) willbe strictly adhered.

• Upon completion of Application for Corridor Right-Way, the company willnotifythe Ute Tribe Energy &
Minerals Department, so that a Tribal Technician can verify Affidavit of Completion.

o Paint equipment/tanks olive black
o 2 foot berm around pad
o 30 mil liner
o Low water crossing at drainage on access road
o Stockpile trees on access
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DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

• A surface and intermediate casing shoe integrity test shall be performed.

• The intermediate casing cement top shall be at the surface.

• The production casing cement top shall be at a minimum of 200' above the intermediate casing
shoe.

AII provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly adhered
to. The following items are emphasized:

DRILLINGICOMPLETIONIPRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

• The spud date and time shall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of spudding.

• Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least 24 hours in
advance of casinq cementinq operations and BOPE &casinq pressure tests.

• All requirements listed in Onshore Order #2 III.E. Special DrillingOperations are applicable for air
drillingof surface hole.

• Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use until the well is completed or abandoned.
Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times. Choke manifolds
shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

• AIIBOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the daily
drillingreport. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order
No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be performed by a
test pump with a chart recorder and i by the rig pumps. Test shall be reported in the driller's log.

• BOP drills shall be initiallyconducted by each drillingcrew within 24 hours of drillingout from under
the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil& Gas Order No. 2.

• Casing pressure tests are required before drillingout from under all casing strings set and cemented
in place.

• No aggressivelfresh hard-banded drillpipe shall be used within casing.

• Cement baskets shall not be run on surface casing.

• The operator must report all shows of water or water-bearing sands to the BLM. Ifflowingwater is
encountered it must be sampled, analyzed, and a copy of the analyses submitted to the BLM Vernal
Field Office.

• The operator must report encounters of all non oil &gas mineral resources (such as Gilsonite, tar
sands, oil shale, trona, etc.) to the Vernal Field Office, in writing, within 5 working days of each
encounter. Each report shall include the well namelnumber, well location, date and depth (from KB
or GL) of encounter, vertical footage of the encounter and, the name of the person making the report
(along with a telephone number) should the BLM need to obtain additional
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• A complete set of angular deviation and directional surveys of a directional well willbe submitted to
the Vernal BLMoffice engineer within 30 days of the completion of the well.

• While actively drilling,chronologicdrillingprogress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM, Vernal
Field Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers untilthe
well is completed.

• A cement bond log (CBL) willbe run from the production casing shoe to the top of cement and shall
be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of the CBL to
this office.

• Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for submittal of
paper logs to the BLM.

• There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling,completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drillingand operating practices must be observed. Any changes in operation must
have prior approval from the BLMVernal Field
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OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

• AIIwells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or markerwith the name of the operator, lease serial
number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

• In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "MonthlyReport of
Operations" (Oiland Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which operations
commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and abandoned. This report
shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver,
Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-1922 (303) 231-3650 for reporting information.

• Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLMVernal Field office must be
notified when it is placed in a producing status. Such notification willbe by written communication
and must be received in this office by not later than the fifthbusiness day followingthe date on which
the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a minimum, the following
informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephone number.

o Well name and number.

o Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royaltywillbe
paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise the
non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unitagreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL)4A and
needs prior approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• Allundesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL3A willbe
reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A,shall be reported
verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than Major Events" will
be reported in writingwithin 15 days. "MinorEvents" willbe reported on the Monthly Report of
Operations and Production.

• Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and Recompletion
Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days after completion of
the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1.
Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled
during the drilling,workover, and/or completion operations, shall be filed on BLMForm 3160-4.
Submit with the well completion report a geologic report including, at a minimum, formation tops, and
a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys, sample descriptions, strip logs,
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data, drillstem test data, and results of production tests if performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid,
and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the BLM,Vernal Field Office.

• Alloff-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease, shall have prior
written approval from the BLMVernal Field Office.

• Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The BLMVernal Field Office
Petroleum Engineers willbe provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all
future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be submitted to the
BLMVernal Field Office. All measurement facilities willconform to the API standards for liquid
hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement. All measurement points shall
be identified as the point of sale or allocation for royalty purposes.

• A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted to
the BLMVernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs first.
All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil &Gas Order No. 3 shall be adhered to. AII
product lines enteringand leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks willbe effectively sealed in
accordance with Onshore Oil &Gas Order No. 3.

• Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which willresult in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filingof a
suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLMVernal Field Office. Emergency approval may be
obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

• No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drillingor workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior approval of
the BLMVernal Field Office. Ifoperations are to be suspended for more than 30 days, prior
approval of the BLMVernal Field Office shall be obtained and notification given before resumption of
operations.

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil &Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water produced
from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent disposal
method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day period. In
order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal method shall be
submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but no later than 45 days
after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not been approved prior to the
end of the authorized 90-day period willbe considered as an Incident of Noncompliance and willbe
grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for disposing of said water is provided
and approved by this office.

• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. Ifa well is suspended or abandoned,
all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent Report of
Abandonment" (Form BLM3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual plugging of the
well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of casing left in hole,
and the current status of the surface



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: QuestarExploration & Production Co

Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20

API No: 43-047-39809 Lease Type: FederallIndina

Section 20 Township 14S Range 20E County Uintah

Drilling Contractor Pete Martin Drilling Rig # Rathole

SPUDDED:
Date 5-29-08

Time 2:00 PM

How Dry

Drilling wi/I Commence:

Reported bv Karri Sails

Telephone # 801-598-5087

Date 5-30-08 Signed



Form31&5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED

on.e1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BudgetBureauNo.1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-lo164

Do not use this form for proposalsto drill or to deepenor reentry to a differentreservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 5. Iffndian,AllotteeorTribeName

UTE TRIBE

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE * """*°rca, Agreementoesignation

1. TypeofWell N/A
Oil Gas

O ** U "" O Other 8. Well Name and No.

FR 6P 20 14 20
2 NameofOpemtor

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. A APIWellNo.

AddressaudTelephoneNo. Contact: Dahn.Caldwell@questar.com 43-047-39809

11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH - VERNAL, UT 84078 435-781-4342 Fax 435-781-4357 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Ama

4 Location of We11(Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED

2110' FNL, 2059' FWL, SENW, SEC 20-T14S-R20E 11. countyor Parish, State

UINTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE B )X(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, )R OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Abandonment C me offm

O Recompletion Nw Cosmo

O Subsequent Repon Plg Non-Routine Fracturing

O CasingRyä WaterShut-Off

O Final Abandonment Notice Mg C Cmo to o

Other SPUD Dispose water

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recomÿletion Regrt and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations(Clearlystate all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starlingany proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true verticaldepths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

On 5/29/08 - Drilled 90' of 30" conductor hole. Set 90' of 20" conductor pipe. Cmtd in place w/ Ready Mix.

RECEIVED
JUNO5 20083 - BLM, 2- Utah OG&M, 1 - ver, 1 - file Word e-server

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is tru and

UNOFOILGy
Signed Dahn F. Caldwell Office Administator H ».'' 6/2/08

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Apptoved by: Title Date

Conditions ofapproval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C.Section 1001, makes it a crimefor any personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency ofthe United Statesany false,fictitiousof fraudulentstatements or
representations as to any matter within its



State of Utah OPERATORACCT. No. N-5085
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: Questar Exploration & Production Co.

ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South
ENTITY ACTIONFORM - FORM6 Vernal, Utah 84078 (435)781-4342

Action Current New Entity API Number Well Name QQ SC TP RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No.

No.
99999 43-047-39809 FR 6P 20 14 20 SENW 20 14S 20E Uintah 5/29/2008

WELL1COMMENTS: ggggg ggCD/RT UURflURI
WELL 2 COMMENTS:

WELL 3 COMMENTS: "' "' 6

WELL 4 COMMENTS:

WELL 5 COMMENTS:

ACTION CODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entity for new well (single wellonly)
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity Signature
D - Re-assign wellfrom one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section) Office Administrator 11 6/2/08

Title Date
NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected

Phone No. (435)781-4342
(3/89)

ONRDE
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: DRILLING Start: 6/9/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Unit Drilling Co. Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: tJNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

5/4/2008 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 LOC 2 DRLCON DRILL30" CONDUCTORTO 90' SET 20" CONDUCTOR PIPE DRILL
MOUSE HOLETO 80' MICHAEL LEE NOTIFIED OF SPUD 12:54,
5/28/2008

11:30 - 01:30 14.00 DRL 9 DRLCON DRILL 15 1/2" SURFACE HOLE F/90' TO 539' TD FOR SURFACE
01:30 - 02:30 1.00 TRP 3 DRLCON TRIP OUT TO RUN 10 3/4" CASING LAYDOWNDRILLSTRING
02:30 - 04:30 2.00 CSG 2 DRLCON RUN 12 JTS OF 10 3/4", #40.5, J-55, ST&C CASING SET AT 520' GL
04:30 - 06:00 1.50 CMT 2 DRLCON CEMENT, PUMPED 70 BBLS OF WATER,20 BBLS OF GEL WATER

AND88 BBLS OF 15.8 PPG 430 SKS OF CEMENT DISPLACEDWITH
46.5 BBLS OF WATER, 10 BBLS OF RETURNS TO PITS FLOAT
HELD. CALLED JAMIESPARGER WITHBLMON CEMENTJOB

6/12/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RDMO RIG DOWNTOP DRIVEUNABLETO BREAKCONNECTIONS FOR
LOAD PATH INSPECTION, GENERAL RIG DOWN

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 OTH RDMO WAITON DAYLIGHT
6/13/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 MIRU RIG DOWN LAY OVER DERRICKUNSTRINGBLOCKS PREPARE

FOR TRUCKS
18:00 - 06:00 12.00 OTH MIRU WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

6/14/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 MIRU RIG DOWNALL WATER AND ELETRICAL LINES DRAIN WATER
TANKSWORK ON SHAKERS PREPARE FOR TRUCKS

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 OTH MIRU WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
6/15/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 3 MIRU MOVE FROM SCS5C TO FR6P USING PIPE LINEROAD, RIG MOVE

50%, RIG DOWN80%, WILL STORE 4 1/2" DRILL STRING ON FR7P
OKAYED BY JOHANNA WILL HAVE TO WATER ROADS FOR DUST
CONTROLL

6/16/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 MIRU GET DERRICK OFF FLOOR, BREAK DOWN SUB, WE ARE PULLING
EVERY LOAD UP HILL ON FLATROCKSIDE RIG MOVE75%, RIG
DOWN 100%

6/17/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 MIRU RIG MOVE 85% - RIG UP 10%, SET MATTINGBOARDS & SUB
18:00 - 06:00 12.00 OTH MIRU WAIT ON DAYLIGHT - WILL MOVECAMPS TODAY

6/18/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 MIRU 90% RIG MOVE &50% RIG UP, STACK BOP, SET UPPER SUB,
FLOOR MOTORS, DRAWWORKS,SHAKER& INTERMEDIATEMUD
TANKS& 1 MIUD PUMP. WILL MOVEDERRICKTODAY

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 OTH MIRU WAITON DAYLIGHTS

MIRU NOTE: ESTIMATEOFF SCS 5C LOCATION THURSDAYEVE
6/19/2008

6/19/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 MIRU 95% RIG MOVE & 70% RIG UP, SET #2 MUD PUMP, SUCTION
TANK,BACKYARD, TOP DOG HOUSES, GAS BUSTER & FLARE
BOX. DERRICK ON LOCATION

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 OTH MIRU WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- MIRU NOTE: SHOULD BE OFF SCS 5C LOCATION FRIDAY, 6/20/2008 - 2

STRINGS TUBULARSLEFT
6/20/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 MIRU 97% RIG MOVE & 90% RIG UP, POWER WASH DERRICK, PIN & SET

ON FLOOR. SET HOPPER HOUSE & SOLIDS EQUIPMENT
(MODIFYING CHOKE LINE &BLOOIELINE BECAUSE OF HEIGHT
DIFFERNENCE IN WELLHEAD)

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 OTH MIRU WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- MIRU NOTE: UNITMECHANICBROUGHTOUT NEW BRAKE BANDSFOR

DRAWWORKS,NOT CORRECT BANDS.BRAKE PADS FOR OLD
BANDSSHOULD BE ON LOCATIONTODAY, 6/20/2008. WILL BE
OFF SCS 5C LOCATIONTODAY 6/20/2008. WILL BREAKTOWERRECE1VED TODAY6/20/2008.

6/21/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 LOC 4 MIRU STRING UP, STRESS TEST DERRICK & RAISE DERRICK, HANG
BACK BRIDLELINE, RIG UP FLOOR & INSTALLCHOKE, PANIC,

DN.0FOL,GAS&MINING Printed: 7/1/2008 10:41:10
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: DRILLING Start: 6/9/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Unit Drilling Co. Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: t)NIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

6/21/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 LOC 4 MIRU FLARE& BLOOIE LINES
- MIRU NOTE: WEATHERFORD AIR PACKAGE SCHEDULED ON LOCATION

THIS AM. CRANE RELEASED @1000 HRS, 4 LOADSTUBULARS
LEFT TO UNLOAD.NOTIFIEDBILLOWEN @0945 HRS W/ BLMOF
INTENT TO TEST BOP &DRILLINTERMEDIATE. NOTIFIEDRACHEL
@1330 HRS W/ UTAHOIL &GAS OF INTENT

6/22/2008 06:00 -01:00 19.00 LOC 4 MIRU 100% RIG UP, PICK UP &HANGTORQUE TUBE, PICK UP SWlVEL &
TOP DRIVE,LOADPATH INSPECTION BYTESCO, HANGSERVICE
LOOP, SET IN WEATHERFORD AIR PACKAGE

01:00 - 06:00 5.00 BOP 2 MIRU TEST BOP &CHOKE W/ 250 PSI LOW& 5000 PSI HIGH
06:00 - MIRU NOTE: WEATHERFORD SHORT HARDLINE.WHEN OFF LOADING

BOOSTER PUMP FOUND 3" CRACKIN ENGINE BLOCKABOVE OIL
PAN. NEW BOOSTER ETA TODAY. HARD LINE THIS AM.

6/23/2008 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 BOP 2 DRLIN1 TEST BOP W/ B&CQUICKTEST. UPPER & LOWER PIPE RAMS,
BLIND RAMS, CHOKE & KILL LINE, CHOKE MANIFOLD,FLOOR
VALVES& DOUBLE BALL Fl TOP DRIVE W/ 250PSI LOW & 5000 PSI
HIGH.TEST ANNULAR Wl2500 PSI. TEST KELLYHOSE,
STANDPIPE & MUD LINESWl250 PSI LOW &3000 PSI HIGH. TEST
SURFACE CASING W/ 1500 PSI FI 30 MIN.

09:00 - 14:00 5.00 OTH DRLIN1 PULL DRAWWORKSBRAKE BANDS& INSTALL NEW BRAKEPADS,
INSTALLBANDS

14:00 - 17:00 3.00 OTH DRLIN1 FINISH LAYING OUT BHA & STRAP, INSTALL SERVICE LOOP TARP
17:00 - 18:00 1.00 OTH DRLIN1 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
18:00 - 20:30 2.50 TRP 1 DRLIN1 MlU 9-7/8" BIT # 1 &TIH PICKINGUP BHA
20:30 - 21:00 0.50 OTH DRLIN1 TEST WEATHERFORDAIRLINESW/ 1500 PSI
21:00 -00:00 3.00 TRP 1 DRLIN1 TIH PICKINGUP BHA
00:00 - 00:30 0.50 OTH DRLIN1 INSTALL ROTATINGHEAD RUBBER
00:30 - 01:30 1.00 OTH DRLIN1 BLOWHOLE DRY (10" VALVE ON FLOW LINE LEAKING,TIGHTEN

BOLTS)
01:30 -03:30 2.00 DRL 4 DRLIN1 DRILLCEMENT, FLOAT EQUIPMENT & CEMENT POCKET FI453'

TO 539'
03:30 - 04:30 1.00 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILL 9-7/8" HOLE W/ AIR Fl 539' TO 628', WOB 18K, ROT 70, 2900

CFM, 225 PSI (DUSTING)
04:30 - 05:00 0.50 SUR 1 DRLIN1 WIRELINESURVEY @618' UNABLETO RETRIEVE SURVEY TOOL
05:00 - 06:00 1.00 TRP 2 DRLIN1 TRIP OUT OF HOLETO RETRIEVE SURVEYTOOL

6/24/2008 06:00-07:00 1.00 TRP 2 DRLIN1 TOOH
07:00 - 08:00 1.00 OTH DRLIN1 RETRIEVE SURVEY, CROWSFOOT WEDGED AGAINST SURVEY

TOOL
08:00 - 10:00 2.00 TRP 2 DRLIN1 TIH W/ BIT # 1, P/U 3 - 6-1/2" DC
10:00 - 16:30 6.50 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILL FI 628' TO 995', WOB 18-20K, RT 70, CFM 2900, PSI 225

(DUSTING)
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RIG 1 DRLIN1 RIG SERVICE
17:00 - 02:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILL Fl995' TO 1636', WOB 18-20K, RT 70, CFM 2900, PSI 300 (

WATER SAND @ 1238', START MISTING@ 1490' -9GPM)
02:30 - 03:00 0.50 SUR 1 DRLIN1 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 1629' =

.4 INC& 164.35 AZ
03:00 - 04:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILL FI 1636' TO 1826', WOB 20-22K, ROT 70, CFM 2900, PSI 310,

MIST 9 GPM
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 OTH DRLIN1 TOTAL TIME CONNECTIONS & REGAIN CIRCULATION

6/25/2008 06:00 - 12:30 6.50 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILL Fl 1826' TO2117', WOB 25-30K, ROT 70, CFM 2900, PSI 330
MIST 9 GPM (MAKINGWATER)

12:30 - 13:00 0.50 RIG 1 DRLIN1 RIG SERVICE
13:00 - 18:30 5.50 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILL FI2117' TO 2507', WOB 30K, ROT 75, CFM 2900, PSI 430

MIST 9 GPM (MAKINGWATER)

I
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: DRILLING Start: 6/9/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Unit Drilling Co. Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours Code C Phase Description of Operations

6/25/2008 18:30 - 19:00 0.50 OTH DRLIN1 REPAR HOLE IN FLOW LINE
19:00 - 22:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILL FI2507' TO 2701', WOB 30K, ROT 75, CFM 2900, PSI 490

MIST9 GPM (MAKINGWATER)
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 SUR 1 DRLIN1 WIRELINESURVEY @2693' =

.5 INC& 240.75 AZ
23:00 - 03:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILL F/ 2701' TO 3050', WOB 30K, ROT 75, CFM 2900, SPM 50, 132

GPM PSI 660 (DRILL Wl AIREATED FLUID @0030 HRS
03:00 -06:00 3.00 OTH DRLIN1 CONNECTIONS & REGAIN CIRCULATION

6/26/2008 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILL FI 3050' TO 3171', WOB 30K, ROT 75, CFM 2900, PS 50, GPM
132, PSI 660

09:00 - 09:30 0.50 RIG 2 DRLIN1 REPAIR WEATHERFORDMIST PUMP
09:30 - 11:30 2.00 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILLFI 3171' TO 3285', WOB 30-35K, ROT 80, CFM 2900, PS 50,

GPM 132, PSI 660
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 RIG 1 DRLIN1 RIG SERVICE
12:00 - 15:00 3.00 OTH DRLIN1 TOTAL TIME CONNECTIONS & REGAINCIRCULATION W/ AIR
15:00 -03:00 12.00 DRL 1 DRLIN1 DRILLFI 3285' TO 3832', WOB 35-40K, ROT 80, CFM 2900, PS 65,

GPM 171, PSI 715 (1900 HRS START REDUCINGAIR &
INCREASINGPUMP STROKES TO MAINTAIN RESERVE PIT LEVEL)

03:00 - 04:30 1.50 CIRC 1 DRLIN1 PUMP 20 BBLSWEEP, PUMP 800 BBL FLUIDINTOFORMATION W/
PUMPS @ 527 GPM - NO AIR

04:30 - 06:00 1.50 TRP 14 DRLIN1 SHORT TRIP TO SHOE - SLM
6/27/2008 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 TRP 15 DRLIN1 FINISH SHORT TRIP TO SHOE 8K MAX OVER PULL &TIH (SLM-NO

CHANGE)
09:30 - 11:30 2.00 CIRC 1 DRLIN1 PUMP SWEEP, CIRCULATE &CONDITION TO RUN CASING
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 SUR 1 DRLIN1 WIRELINE SURVEY
12:00 - 14:30 2.50 TRP 2 DRLIN1 TOOH TO RUN CASING
14:30 - 15:30 1.00 TRP 1 DRLIN1 LAY DOWN 6-1/2" &8" DRILL COLLARS
15:30 - 17:00 1.50 OTH DRLIN1 CLEAN FLOOR, PULL WEAR BUSHING,CHANGE OUT BAILS&

ELEVATORS
17:00 - 19:00 2.00 CSG 1 DRLIN1 RIG UP FRANKSCASING CREW, HOLDSAFETY MEETING
19:00 - 23:00 4.00 CSG 2 DRLIN1 RUN 22 JTS 7-5/8", 29.7#, P110, LT&C CASING
23:00 -23:30 0.50 RIG 2 DRLIN1 REPAIR HYDRAULICLEAK TO DOUBLE BALL VALVE TOP DRIVE
23:30 -03:00 3.50 CSG 2 DRLIN1 RUN 59 JTS CASINGTOTAL 81 JTS, SHOE @3812', FLOAT

COLLAR@3718.6'
03:00 - 04:00 1.00 CSG 2 DRLIN1 LAND MANDRIL & BREAK CIRCULATION
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 OTH DRLIN1 R/D FRANKS,PACKOFF WELLHEAD &TEST W/ 5000 PSI

6/28/2008 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 CMT 2 CSGIN1 SPOT PUMP TRUCKS &WAIT ON HALLIBURTON NITROGEN
TRUCKS

10:30 - 14:00 3.50 CMT 1 CSGIN1 SPOT N2 TRUCKS &RIG UP HALLIBURTON
14:00 - 18:30 4.50 CMT 2 CSGIN1 SAFETY MEETING,TEST CEMENT LINES TO 6000 PSI N2 LINESTO

9000 PSI, PUMP 10 BBLFOAMED WATER,20 BBLFOAMED SUPER
FLUSH, 20 BBLFOAMEDWATER. PUMP 91 BBL 345 SKS YlELD
1.48 FOAMED DENSITY 8.5 LB/GAL, PUMP FOAMED TAIL CEMENT
@5 BBL/MIN 80 BBL 305 SKS, PUMP UNFOAMED TAIL @43.5 BBL
165 SKS, 14.3 LB/GAL, DROP PLUG DISPLACE W/ 169.2 BBL
WATER, BUMP MPLUGW/ 1300 PSI, FLOATSHELDW/ 1.7 BBL
BACK,NO RETURNS DURINGENTIRE JOB, PUMP CAP CEMENT 55
BBL, 200 SKS @14.6 LB/GAL

18:30 - 19:30 1.00 CMT 1 CSGIN1 RIG DOWN CEMENTERS (NOTIFIED @2100 HRS BY ENGINEER
SEAN JONES &CEMENTER CHRIS THATVALVESON "A" SECTION
WERE CLOSED DURINGCEMENTJOB)

19:30 -22:00 2.50 OTH CSGIN1 REPAIR FLOW LINE, CHANGE OUT BAILS & ELEVATORS & CLEAN
FLOOR

22:00 - 00:00 2.00 OTH CSGIN1 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING,STRAP & PICK UP BHA
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: DRILLING Start: 6/9/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Unit Drilling Co. Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

6/28/2008 00:00 -03:30 3.50 TRP 2 CSGIN1 M/UBIT#2 &TIH TO 3650'
03:30 - 04:30 1.00 OTH CSGIN1 TEST CASINGWI 1500 PSI
04:30 -05:00 0.50 TRP 2 CSGIN1 TIH TO 3670', TAG CEMENTSTRINGERS
05:00 - 06:00 1.00 DRL 4 CSGIN1 DRILLCEMENT & FLOATEQUIPMENT

6/29/2008 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 DRL 4 DRLPRO DRILLFLOATEQUIPMENT &CEMENT POCKET TO 3832'
06:30 - 07:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL6-1/2" HOLEWl.46 MUD MOTOR& PDC BIT Fl 3832' TO

3845', WOB 6K, ROT 10, RPM 110, PS 80, PP 1000
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 EQT 2 DRLPRO FIT W/ 8.45# AMW & 722 PSI = 12.06# EMW
07:30 - 14:30 7.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL Fl 3845' TO 4030', WOB 6-13K, ROT 10, RPM 115, PS 85, PP

1100 (3904' TO 3970', ROP 14.6 FT/HR - WOB 6-24K)
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RIG 1 DRLPRO RIG SERVICE
15:00 - 22:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL Fl 4030' TO 4419', WOB 7-15K, ROT 10, RPM 115, PS 85, PP

1200
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 SUR 1 DRLPRO WIRELINE SURVEY @4353' = 1.6 INC & 192.35 AZ
22:30 - 04:00 5.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FI 4419' TO 4938', WOB 6-16K, ROT 10, RPM 115, PS 85, PP

1310
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 OTH DRLPRO TOTAL TIME FI COINNECTIONS

6/30/2008 06:00 - 08:30 2.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL F/ 4938' TO 5019', WOB 6-28K, ROT 10, RPM 115, PS 85, PP
1425

08:30 - 09:30 1.00 CIRC 1 DRLPRO DROP SURVEY& PUMP DRYSLUG
09:30 - 12:30 3.00 TRP 2 DRLPRO TOOH W/ BIT #2 (WET)
12:30 - 13:30 1.00 OTH DRLPRO RETRIEVE SURVEY, CHANGE OUT BIT & MUD MOTOR (3 JET

NOZZLES PLUGGED)
13:30 - 14:30 1.00 TRP 2 DRLPRO SURFACE TEST MUDMOTOR &TIH WI BIT#3 & .26 MUD MOTOR
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RIG 1 DRLPRO RIG SERVICE
15:00 - 16:30 1.50 TRP 2 DRLPRO TIH TO 4938'
16:30 - 17:30 1.00 RIG 2 DRLPRO TOTALTIMEON TRIP ATTEMPTINGTO REPAIR SMITH TRU

TORQUE
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 REAM 1 DRLPRO WASH & REAM F/ 4938' TO 5019' (PRECAUTIONARY)
18:00 - 04:30 10.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FI 5019' TO 5794', WOB 10-12K, ROT 40, RPM 110, PS 100, PP

1450
04:30 - 06:00 1.50 OTH DRLPRO TOTAL TIMEFI CONNECTIONS

7/1/2008 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FI 5794' TO 5878', WOB 10-12K, ROT 40, RPM 110, PS 100, PP
1475

07:30 - 08:00 0.50 SUR 1 DRLPRO WIRELINE SURVEY @5841' = MISS RUN
08:00 - 10:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL Fl 5878' TO 5975', WOB 10-12K, ROT 40, RPM 110, PS 100, PP

1500
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 SUR 1 DRLPRO WIRELINE SURVEY@5935' = 4.2 INC&209.55 AZ
10:30 - 13:30 3.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL F/ 5975' TO 6070', WOB 10-12K, ROT 40, RPM 110, PS 100, PP

1500
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 RIG 1 DRLPRO RIG SERVICE &CHANGE OUT FUEL FILTERSTOP DRIVE
14:00 - 23:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILL FI 6070' TO 6461', WOB 10-12K, ROT 40, RPM 110, PS 100, PP

1500
23:30 - 00:30 1.00 SUR 1 DRLPRO WIRELINE SURVEY @6426' = 4.2 INC& 204.95 AZ
00:30 - 04:30 4.00 DRL 1 DRLPRO DRILLFI 6461' TO 6655', WOB 10-12K, ROT 10, RPM 75, PS 95, PP

1450
04:30 - 06:00 1.50 OTH DRLPRO TOTALTIME FI CONNECTIONS

Printed: 7/1/2008 10:41:10
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASINWELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CS
e Phase Description of Operations

9/16/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"

On 9/15/08 MIRUBasin Well Service rig #1. NU frac head assembly
with single ram BOP on top. SIFN. On 9/16/08 willstart to tally and
rabbit in the hole with bit and scraper and new tbg...

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

9/17/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 LOC 2 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"

On 9/16/08 SICP=0#. Tally and rabbit in the hole with 3-3/4" mill and
4-1/2" csg.scraper and new 2-3/8" EU 8rd 4.7# P-110 tbg. to 9850'.
SlFN. On 9/17/08 will continue to tallyand rabbit in the hole with new
tbg.to PBTD.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

9/22/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 FISH 1 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"

On 9/17/08 SITP and SICP=0#. Continue to tally and rabbit in the hole
with mill and scraper and new tbg.and tag fillat 12515'. Circ.hole down
to 12545' (new PBTD-9/17/08). Circ.hole clean with 2% KCLwater.
POOH with milland scraper and tbg..SI well. On 9/18 and 9/19/08 well
will remain Si pending logging and perforating on 9/22/08.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

9/23/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 PERF 1 C-OTH "TIGHTHOLE"

On 9/22/08 SICP=0#. MIRUCased Hole Solutions. Fill hole with 2%
KCLwater. Run a CBL/VDLIGRlog from tag at 12531' to 500' with top
of cement est.at 1050'. Correlated to Halliburton Density log dated
7/27/08 run #1. Pressure test csg with quick test to 6500# along with
frac head. Pressure test to full manifold and related valves to 8500#.
OK. RDMO Quick test. Bled off all pressure. Perforate the following
Wingate intervals using a 2-3/4" csg.gun at 3 JPF and 120° phasing per
the CBL log dated 9/22/08: 12464-72' and 12484-92' (IFL and FFL at
surface and no blow or vacuum after perforating). RDMO Cased Hole
Solutions and SIFN. Total of 48 holes. On 9/23/08 willRIH with
ret.packer and tbg...

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

Printed: 10/2/2008 12:17:15
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

9/23/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 PERF 1 C-OTH
9/24/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 C-OTH "TIGHTHOLE"

On 9/23/08 SICP=0#. RIH with 4-1/2" ret.packer and tbg.and set
packer at 12296'. Break down Wingate perfs.at 2200# and pump 10
bbl.of 2% KCL water at i BPM at 2400# with ISIP=2000#. Bled off
tbg..RU swab. IFLat surface. Make 6 swab runs and recovered 25
bbl.of water with no gas and FFL at 4000'. RD swab and SIFN. On
9/24/08 will acidize Wingate perfs.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 52
Minus daily recovery: 25
Plus water today: 10
LLTR:37

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

9/25/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 C-OTH "TIGHTHOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'
On 9/24/08 SITP and SICP=0# with packer set at 12286' to test above
wingate perfs. RU swab. IFL at 3700'. Make 1 swab and recovered 3
bbis of water with no gas. MIRUHalliburton acid crew, acidized
Wingate intervals 12464-72' & 12484-92' as follows: Pump 2000 gal.of
15% HCL acid with additives with 75-7/8" Bio-balls recovered
throughoutthe acid and flush with 60 bbis of 2% KCL water over 4.1
rpm, Avg. at 4650#. several 10-20# breaks. ISIP=1650#. Total of 110
bbl.of load. RDMO Halliburton. Open tbg.and flowed back 1/2 bbl of
water and tbg. died. RU swab IFL at surface. Make 1swab with and
recovered 58 bbl.of slight gas cut water with FFL at 3700'. Final PH=1.
Had show of gas. LLR=52 bbl.RD swab and SIFN. On 9/25/08 will
continue to swab and/or flow.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 17
Minus daily recovery: 88
Plus water today: 110
LLTR: 89

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

9/26/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'

Printed: 10/2/2008 12:17:15
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-90-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLllTION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASINVIELLSERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

9/26/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 C-OTH On 9/25/08 SITP=50# and SICP=0# with packer set at 12296'. Bled off
tbg.withno fluid recovery. RU swab. IFL at 2500'. Make 18 swab runs
and recovered 85 bbl.of med gas cut water with a final PH=7 and a final
fluid level at 4800' while pulling from 6300'. RD swab and SIFN. On
9/26/08 will continue to swab.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 89
Minus daily recovery: 85
LLTR:4

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

9/29/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 C-OTH "TIGHTHOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'

On 9/26/08 SITP=50#and SICP=0# with packer set. Bled off tbg.with
no fluid recovery. RU swab. IFL at 3200'. Make 1 swab run to 4800'
and tag something in tbg.and sandline spun and POOH with sandline
and tools. Had to Cut off sandline and having trouble with drum.
Rcovered 4 bbl.of water and SIFW. On 9/29/08 will check out drum and
possibly splace sandline and swab after takinggas analysis.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 4
Minus daily recovery: 4

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

9/30/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'

On 9/29/08 SITP-300# and SICP=0# with packer set. Took gas analysis
from tbg.withthe following results: N2-3.3%; Methane=72.5%;
CO=22.9%; BTU-758; Grav.0.7978. Bled off tbg.withno fluid recovery.
RU swab. IFLat 3400'. Make 15 swab runs and recovered 69 bl.of very
slight gas cut water with traces of tarry black hard oil. FFL at 5000'
while pulling from 6200'. RD swab and SIFN. On AM of 9/30/08
SITP=100#and SICP=0#. RU swab. IFLat 3700'. Willcontinue to
swab on 9/30/08.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110

Printed: 10/2/2008 12:17:15
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

9/30/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 C-OTH Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 0
Minus daily recovery: 69
LLTR:69 over

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

10/1/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'

On 9/30/08 SITP=100# and SICP=0# with packer set. Bled off tbg.with
no fluid recovery. RU swab out at 3700'. Make 22 swab runs and
pressured 79 bbis at very slight gas out with FFL at 6500' with a slight
trace of gas. FFL holding at 5800, 6500'. Have a totalof 148 bbl over
load. RD swab and SIFN. On 10/1/08 will run a gas sample and wait
on orders.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 69
Minus daily recovery: 79
LLTR: 148 over

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

10/2/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'

On 10/1/08 SITP=250# and SICP=0# with packer set at 12306'. Took
gas sample with the following results from Wingate perfs.12404-72' and
12484-92'. N2-3.71% Methane=77%, CO2=17.87% BTU=806.39';
Grav=0.7516. Bled off well with no fluid recovery. RU swab IFL at
4200'. Make 10 swab runs and recovered 38 bbl.of very slight gas cut
water with FFL at 7100' while pulling from 8600' on the last 2 runs. RD
swab and SIFN. On 10/2/08 will release packer and POOH with packer
and tbg.and wireline set a CIBP and perforate additional intervals.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 148 over
Minus daily recovery: 38
LLTR: 186 over

Printed: 10/2/2008 12:17:15
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLIJTION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

10/2/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 C-OTH

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASINWELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

10/31/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 C-OTH
Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'

11/3/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 PERF 2 C-OTH "TIGHTHOLE" - Completion
CIBP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over the Keyenta at
12280' (10-14-08) Now testingthe Entrada gross perforated interval
11898-12050'
CIBP over Entrada at 11870' (10/24/08)
Now test Buckhourn Intentals 11192'-96' and 11204-16'

On 10/31/08 SICP=0#. Install frac head equipment. MIRUCased Hole
Solutions and perforate the following Dakota Silt intervals per the CBL
log dated 9/22/08 using a 2-3/4" csg.gun at 3 JPF and 120° charges:
10838-40' and 10853-47' (18 holes). No change in pressure on the well
after perforating. Could not detct FL but was high. RDMO Cased Hole
Solutions. Si the well for the weekend for frac scheduled on 11/3/08.
Frac has been delayed to 11/4/08

Load from yesterday: 15

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'

11/4/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"- Completion
CIBP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) ClBP over the Keyenta at
12280' (10-14-08) Now testing the Entrada gross perforated interval
11898-12050'
CIBP over Entrada at 11870' (10/24/08)
Now test Buckhourn Intervals 11192'-96' and 11204-16'

Printed: 12/1/2008 10:26:20
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASINWELL SE RVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

11/4/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 C-OTH On PM of 11/3/08 start to MIRUHalliburton frac crew. Supposed to
start fracing AMof 11/4/08. Left well SIFN.

Load from yesterday: 15

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

11/5/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE" - Completion
CIBP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over the Keyenta at
12280' (10-14-08) Now testingthe Entrada gross perforated interval
11898-12050'
CIBP over Entrada at 11870' (10/24/08)
Now test Buckhoum Intervals 11192'-96' and 11204-16'

On 11/4/08 SICP=50#, MIRUHalliburton frac crew and Cased Hole
Solutions. Frac gross perforated Buckhorn and with 400 gal.of 15%
HCL acid followed by a 20500 gal.pad and stage 0.50 to 1.50 ppg 30/50
resing coated sand in 102000 gal.of fluid with 7500 gal.spacers in
between sand stages and flush with 7423 gal.of slick water. Total of
3900 bbl.of water and a total of 99330# of sand. Max.rate=47.1;
Ave=39.8 BPM; Max.psi=7574#; Ave=4986#; ISIP=4115# (.81).This
was stage #4; Lubricate in a 4-1/2" comp.frac plug and set at 10800'.
Perforate the following Mancos intervals per the CBL log dated 9/22/08
the following intervals at 3 JPF at 120° phasing using a 2-3/4" csg.as
gun: 9986'; 9974'; 9981'; 10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489'; 10662'; 10718'.

Zone #5: (Mancos gross interval 9966-10718'): Frac this interval using a
2% KCL slick water system as follows: Breakdown with 400 gal.of 15%
HCL acid followed by a 10000 gal.pad and stage 0.50 to 1.50 ppg 30/50
resing coated sand in 40000 gal of water with each stage follwed by a
6000 gal.spacer and flush with 6870 gal.of slick water. Total of 1990
bbl.of water and a totalof 40200#of sand. Max.rate=40.5; Ave=39.4
BPM; Max.psi=7343#; Ave=6103#; ISIP=4346# (.86).Lubricate in a
4-1/2" comp.frac plug and set at 9920'.
Zone #6: Perforate the following Mancos intervals per the above gun
and log as follows: 9382'; 9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533'; 9608'; 9654'; 9713';
9761'; &9860'.
Zone #6: (Mancos gross interval 9382-9860'); Breakdown with 400
gal.of 15% HCL acid and frac with a 10500 gal.pad and stage 0.5 to 1.5
ppg sand in 41000 gal.of fluidwith 6000 gal.spacer in between sand
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLI:TION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Wall Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASINVIELLSE RVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

11/5/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 C-OTH stages and flush with 6800 gal.of slick water. Total of 36000#of sand
and a total load of 2010 bbl..Max.rate of 40.5; Ave=36.6 BPM;
Max.psi=7386#; Ave=5751#; ISIP-4005#; (.85).SIFN. On 11/5/08 will
continue with additional zones.

LLTR: 7900

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.

11/6/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 C-OTH "TIGHTHOLE"

On AMof 11/5/08 SICDP=2300#. Lubricate in a 4-1/2" comp.frac plug
and set at 9330'. Perforate Zone #7 (Mancos) as follows using a 2-3/4"
csg.gun at JPF and 120° phasing per the CBL log dated 9/22/08: 8573';
8584'; 8693'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184'; 9246'; 9267' & 9286' (30 holes).

Frac with Halliburton as follows:
Zone #7: (Mancos-8573-9286'): Breakdown with 400 gal.of 15% HCL
and frac with a 2% KCL slickwater system as follows: Pump a 10200
gal.pad and stage 0.5 to 1.5 ppg 30/50 resin coated sand in 34000
gal.of fluid with 4-6000 gal.spacer stages and flush with 6000 gal.of slick
water. Total of 37500# of sand and a total load of 2100 bbl.
Max.rate=42; Ave=39.4 BPM; Max.psi=7195#; Ave=5771#; ISIP=3260#
(.80).Lubricate in a 4-1/2" comp.frac plug and set at 8500'. Perforate
the following Mancos interval per the above gun and log:
Zone #8: 7908'; 7913'; 7918'; 8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212'; 8285'; 8362' &
8435' (30 holes). RDMO Cased Hole Solutions. Frac zone #8 as
follows:
Zone #8: (Mancos: 7908-8436'): Breakdown with 400 gal.of 15% HCL
and frac with the above system and sand as follows: Pump a 10100
gal.pad and stage 0.5 to 1.5 ppg 30/50 sand in 44500 gal.of fluid with
4-6000 gal.spacer stages and flush with 5400 gal.of slick water. Total of
41000#of sand and a total load of 2155 bbl.Max.rate=40,9; Ave=39.8
BPM; Max.psi=6718#; Ave=5134' ISIP=3260# (.84).SI the well and
RDMO Halliburton. After a 2-1/2 hr. period, SICP=2700#. Open the
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: ITR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: I R 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Hasin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: 13ASINWELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Phase Description of Operations

11/6/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 C-OTH csg.on a 18/64" choke at 3:30PM on 11/5/08. Continue to flow the well
overnight and at 6:30AM on 11/6/08 FCP-2100# on a 18/64" choke with
an hourly flow rate est.at 80 bbl.per hour with light gas and a trace of
sand and a total recovery in the last 15 hours of 1120 bbl..Continue to
flow the well to clean up.

Load from yesterday: 7900
Minus daily recovery: 1120
Plus water today: 4255
LLTR: 10975

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267'; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/7/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 C-OTH "TIGHTHOLE"

On 6:30 AM on 11/6/08 FCP =2100# on a 18/64" choke with an hourly
flow rate est.at 80 bbl.per hour with light gas and a total recovery since
the frac of 1120 bbl..Continue to flow the ell during the day and evening
andat 11:30PM on 11/6/08 FCP=150-200# on 2-1" chokes for the last 4
hours and flowing heavy gas at a rate of 90 bbl.per hour with a total
recovery of 2410 bbl..SI the well at 11:30 PM on 11/6/08 to see what the
well will build up to with pressure and attempt to bleed of gas head in
AM to RIH with mili and tbg. At 7:00AM on 11/7/08 after a 7-1/2 hours.

Load from yesterday: 10975
Minus daily recovery: 1290
LLTR:9685
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

11/7/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 C-OTH
Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267'; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/10/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"

On AM of 11/7/08 SICP =1600# aftera 7-1/2 hour SI period. Attempt to
bleed off well on varius chokes and after 3 hurs FCP=1550# on a 14/64"
choke and recovered 70 bbl.of high gas cut water. SI the well for 1-1/2
hours with a SICP after the 2-1/2 hours of 2000#. MIRULone Wolf WL
and wireline set a 4-1/2" comp.BP at 7800'. Bled off casing and RDMO
Lone Wolf. ND frac head assembly and NU 10K BOP stack. SIFN. On
11/8/08 will RIH with milland tbg.and start to drillout composite plugs.

On 11/8/08 SICP=0#. RIH with 3-3/4" milland tbg.to 7790'. Load hole
with 80 bbl.of 2% KCL water and est.circ..Pressure test BOP and flow
manifold to 2000#. Drillout composite BP at 7800' and flowed the kick
on 2-48/64" chokes with a max.psi of 750#. Circ.hole clean with 2%
KCLwater and flow the well on a 48/64" choke at 500#and RIH to 7860'
and Si pipe rams and RD swivel and night cap tbg.whileflowing the
csg.to the pit. Start to flow the csg.to the pit at 2:00 PM on 11/8/08 on a
48/64" choke with 500# FCP at a rate of 50 bbl.per hour with med.gas
and no gas. Continue to flow the well over the weekend with the
following:At 8:00AMon 11/9/08 on a 48/64" choke and at 4:00PM on
11/9/08 FCP=550# at a rate of 5 bbl.per hour of heavy gas cut. Place
on a 18/64" choke and at 5:00AM on 11/10/08 FCP=800# with 5 bbl.per
st 15 hours of 1120 bbl..Continue to flow the well to clean up. est total
recovery of 500 bbl.of water. On 11/10/08 will attempt to drillout
remaining composite frac plugs.

Printed: 12/1/2008 10:26:20
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLI ETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: liasin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: IlASIN WELL SE RVICE Rig Number: 1

Sub iDate From - To Hours Code Code Phase Description of Operations

11/10/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 C-OTH Load from yesterday: 9535
Minus daily recovery: 800
LLTR:8735

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267'; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/11/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 FISH 1 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"

On 11/10/08 FCP =800# on a 18/64" choke. Open csg. on a full 1"
choke and FCP=200#. RIHwith mil and tbg. and tag comp. free plug at
8500' and drillout plug with foam unit. Continue in he hole and tag
comp.frac plug at 9330' and drillout frac plug with foam. Continue in
the hole and tag and drillup composite frac plug at 9920' Continue in
the hole and tag composite frac plug at 10800'. Pull mill to 10780' and
SIFN. Too late to drillout plug. On 11/11/08 will drillout frac plug at
10800' and clean out well and layd down approx.4000' of tbg..

Recovered all water pumped today.

LLTR:8735

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: liasin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: [3ASINWELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

11/11/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 FISH 1 C-OTH 11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267'; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/12/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SEQ 1 C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"

On 11/11/08 SITP =400# with float in bit sub assembly and
SICP=2300#. RU power swivel and foam unit and tag comp.frac plug at
10800' and drillout frac plug. Continue in the hole with mill and tbg.and
tag new PBTD at 11785'. RD foam unit. POOH and lay down 2-3/8"
P-110 tbg.to9100' and SIFN. On 11/12/08 will continue to POOH and
LD2-3/8" P-110 tbg.and start to RIH with new 2-3/8" L-80 tbg..

Rec.all water used today.
LLTR:8735

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhom: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASINWELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

11/12/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SEQ 1 C-OTH 9246'; 9267'; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/13/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 OTH C-OTH "TIGHT HOLE"

On 11/12/08 continue to repair rig.

24 Hour Forecast: Willfinish POOH &laying doen P-110 tbg and start
to RlH w/ new 2-3/8" L-80 as a production string.

Rec.all water used today.
LLTR:8735

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267'; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/14/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 5 C-OTH "TIGHTHOLE" - COMPLETION

On 11/13/08 - SITP = 1700# & SICP = 2750#. Open up well & bled
down & pump 30 bbls of 2% KCLwater down the tbg & POOH & lay
down 289 jts of P-110 tbg. ND top set of pipe rams. SIFN. On
11/14/08 WillRIH wl L-80 tbg for production string. Had to pump an
additional 100 bbis of 2% KCL water to top kill, but well flowed back all
that was pumped today.

Rec. all water used today.
LLTR: 8735 bbls

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: I2R 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Ilasin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: ISASINWELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

11/14/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 5 C-OTH Csg Depth: 12601' FC @12600'???

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267'; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/17/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 C-OTH "TIGHTHOLE"

On 11/14/08 SICP=1700#. Bled down to 200# and pump 100 bbl.of 2%
KCL water. Tally and rabbit in the hole with new 2-3/8" EUE 8rd 4.7#
L-80 production tbg.as follows: collar; 1 jt; 1.81" "F" nipple and 245 jts.of
tbg...Land tbg.tail at 7820'. ND BOP's and NUWH. Turn well over to
production department. Casing was flowing the last 2 hours of running
tbg...On 11/17/08 will RDMO Basin WS #1.
Report discontinued until fulther activity. Alltbg.is landed high to
production log. Recovered all water pumped today.

LLTR:8735 bbls

Tbg.Detail: collar=(0.44'); 1 jt.oftbg. (31.76'); "F" nipple = (.84');245
jts.oftbg..(7765.48';); KB=22'. Tbg.tail at 7820.47'; "F" nipple at 7788'.
Alldepths are KB depths.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Csg Depth: 12601' FC @12600'???

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: I R 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: liasin Well Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: 13ASINWELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

11/17/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 C-OTH Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhom: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267'; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: FR 6P-GO-14-20
Common Well Name: FR 6P-10-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLIETION Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Basin Wéll Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: BASIN VIELL SE RVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

12/17/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 C-OTH Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267'; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

12/18/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 C-OTH "TIGHTHOLE"
This well work willbe to lower tbg.to finish completion of well.

On 12/17/08 TP and CP=25#. Bled down well and pump 15 bbl.of 2%
KCLwater down the tbg..RU Basin WS #3. NDWH and NU BOP's.
Tally and rabbit in the hole with 37 jts of 2-3/8" 4.7# EUE 8rd L-80
tbg.and 22 jts.of 2-3/8"4.7# EUE 8rd P-110 tbg.for a total of 304 jts.of
tbg.inthe hole putting the tubingtailat 9670'. ND BOP's and NUWH RD
Basin WS. Leftwell SI overnight to build pressure. On 12/18/08 SITP
and SICP=1000#. Preparing to put well on line to production
department and to RDMOBasin WS. Final report of well completion.

LLTR:8735

Tbg.Ðetail:collar=(0.44'); 1 jt.oftbg. (31.76'); "F" nipple = (.84');245
jts.oftbg..(7765.48';);KB=22'. Tbg.tail at 7820.47'; "F" nipple at 7788'.
Alldepths are KBdepths.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Csg Depth: 12601' FC @12600'???

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 998t';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';

Printed: 1/5/2009 9:58:48 AM

DE OFOL
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Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: ITR 6P-20-14-20
Common Well Name: I R 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Event Name: COMPLI TlON Start: 9/15/2008 End:
Contractor Name: 13asin Wal\ Service Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: IlASIN WELLSE RVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Phase Description of Operations

12/18/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 C-OTH 9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267'; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

Printed: 1/5/2009 9:58:48



Form 3160-4
(Augusf2907)

UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137

' BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: July 31, 2010

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. LeaseSerialNo.
UTU-10164

la. Type of Well OOil Well Gas Well Dry O Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: New Well O Work Over Deepen Plug Back Diff. Resvr.. UTE TRIBE

Other: 7 Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

2. Name of Operator 8. Lease Name and Well No.
Questar Exploration & Production Co- FR 6P 20 14 20
3. Address 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH - VERNAL, UT 84078 3a. Phone No. (include area codel 9. AFI Well No.

435.781.4342 - Dahn Caldwell 43-047-39809
4. Location of Well (Report location clear/r and in accordance with Federal requirements)* 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory

2110' FNL, 2059' FWL, SENW, SEC 20-T14S-R20E UNDES1GNATED
At surface 11. Sec., T., R., M., on Block and

Survey or Area SEC 20-T14s-R20E

At top prod. interval reported below 12. County or Parish 13. State

At totaldepth (Bottom) 2512' FNL, 1858' FWL, SENW, S20-Tí4S-R20E UINTAH UT

14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed 11/15/2008 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*
05/29/2008 07/27/2008 OD & A g Ready to Prod. 7,360' KB
18. Total Depth: MD 12,623' 19. Plug BackT.D.: MD 12,600' 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD CISP @ 11870', 12280', 12450'

TVD TVD TVD
21. o & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Was well cored? No Yes (Submit analysis)

BL SPECTRAL DENSITY DSN ARRAY COMP TRUE RESISTIVITY) Ûffg WasDSTrun? No Yes (Submit report)
Directional Survey? No Yes (Subnut copy)

23. Casing2 nd Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#lft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD)
StageOementer No. of Sks. & Slurry Vol. Cement Top* Amount PulledDepth Type of Cement (BBL)

15-1/2" 10-3/4" 40.5# 520' 430 SXS SURF - CIRC
9-7/8" 7-5/8" 29.7# 3812' 1,015 SXS SURF - UNK
6-1/2" 4-1/2" 13.5# 12,602' 1,125 SXS 1,050' - LOG

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Ðepth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)

2-3/8" 9671'
25. Producing Intervals 4 p Qgfgg -gþ C ()(y 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A) SEE ATTACHMENT ONE SEE ATTACHMENT ONE
B)

C)

D)

27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, etc.
Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material

SEE ATTACHMENT ONE SEE ATTACHMENT ONE

28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Date Hours fest 3il Gas Water Dil Gravity 3as Production Method
Produced Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Carr. API 3ravity FLOWING
11/15/08 12/2/08 24 12 280 80

Choke Ibg. Press Osg. 24 Hr 3il 3as Water 3as/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio PRODUCING

? 272 739
28a. Production - Interval B
Date First fest Date Hours fest 3il 3as Water OilGravity 3as Production Method
Produced Tested Production BBL MCF SBL Corr.API 3ravity RECEIVED
Choke Tbg. Press. Osg. 24 Hr. 3il 3as Water 3as/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF SBL Ratio

*(See instructions and spaces for ad data on page



28b. Production - Interval C
Date First Test Date Hours fest 3il Gas Water 3il Gravity 3as Production Method
Produced Tested Production 3BL MCF BBL Corr. API 3ravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24Hr 3il Gas Water 3as/Oil Well Status
Size F1wg. Press. Rate BBL MCF SBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production - Interval D
Date First restDate Hours fest 3il 3as Water Gil Gravity 3as roduction Method
Produced Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API 3ravity

Choke Tbg. Press sg. 24 Hr. 3il 3as Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rate 3BL MCF SBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Solid, usedfor fuel,vented, etc.)
SOLD

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests,
including depth interval tested,cushion used, timetool open, flowingand shut-in pressures and
recoveries.

Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name

Meas. Depth

CASTLEGATE 6688'

BLACKHAWK 6939'

DAKOTA SILT 10839'

MORRISON 11230'

CURTIS 11772'

ENTRADA 11889'

32. Additional remark (includep ugging procedure):

FUTURE OIL PROSPECTS: GREEN RIVER

33. Indicate which items have been attachedby placing a check in the appropriate boxes:

Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full setreq'd.) O Geologic Report CDST Report Directional Survey

Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification Core Analysis Other: PERFORATION &FRACINGREPORT

34. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined fromall available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please int JIM SIMONTON Title COMPLETION SUPERVISOR

Signature
,

Date ÛÌ/ÛÛ/2ÛÛS

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the UnitedStates any
false, fictitiousor flaudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. -A gg pgas
(Continued on page 3) 3160-4,page



FR 6P 20-14-20 - Attachment One
PERFORATION DETAIL:
Open Petfs | Stimulation i Perf Status

7908' ' Open -Mancos
7913' Open-Mancos
7918' Open-Manoms

8014' Open-Manox;

8021' Open-ManoDS

8151' > Frac w/ 41,000 Lbs in 90,510 Gals Open - Mancos
8212' Open-Mano3s

8265' Open-Mancos

8362' - - - -- Open - Mances-
8435'

,

Open-Mano3s

8573' ' Open-Manom;

8584' Open-Manom;

8593' Open-Mancos
8612' Open-Manoœs
8920' Open-Manoœs

9063' » Frac w/ 37,500 Lbs in 88,200 Gals Open - Mancos
9184' Open-Mana3s
9246' Cipen-Mano3s
9267' Open-Mancos
9286'

,

Open-Mancos

9382' ' Open-Mancos
9408' Open-Mano35
9462' Open-Mancos

9488' Open-Manoms

9533' Cipen-Manoms

9608' > Frac w/ 36,000 Lbs in 84,420 Gals Open - Mancos
9654' Open-Mancos

9713' Open-Manom;

9761' Open-Mancos

9860' Open-Mancos

9986' Open-Mano3s
9979' Open-Mancos
9981' Open-Manom;

10146' Open-Mancos

10298' - Frac w/ 40,200 Lbs in 83,580 Gals Open - Mancos
10475' Open-Mano3s
10489' Open-Mancos

10662' Open-Mancos
10718'

,



10838'- 10840' Open - Dakota Silt
10843' - 10847' Frac w/ 99,300 Lbs in 163,800 Gals Open - Dakota Silt
11192'- 11196' Open - Buckhorn
11204'- 11216' Acidizew/ 2,000 Galsof 15% HCL Acid Open - Buckhorn

CIBP @ 11,870' CIBP@11,870'

11898' - 11904' Closed - Entrada
11926' - 11930' Closed - Entrada
11986'- 11994' Acidize w/ 2,000 Galsof 15% HCL Acid Closed - Entrada
12048' - 12050' Closed - Entrada

CIBP@12,280' CIBP@12,280'

12312'- 12320' Frac w/ 52,700 Lbs in 19,530 Gals Closed - Keyenta
12368'- 12374' And 95 Tons of CO2cut Closed - Keyenta

CIBP@12,450' CIBP @12,450'

12464' - 12472' Closed - Wingate
12484'- 12492' Acidize w/ 2,000 Gals of 15% HCL Acid Closed -
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Deviation Summary
Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 s/T # v.s. Azi (°)
TMD:12,573.0 (ft) TVD: 12,555.48 (ft) Spud Date: 5/3/2008 OH 0.00Closure Distance: 449.1 (ft) Closure Direction: 206.54 (°) Calculation Method: Minimurn Curvature
S/T# TMD Angle Azimuth CTM TVD N/-S El-W Vert. Section DLS BUR Type

(ft) (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°/100ft) (°l100ft)

OH 0.0 0.00. 0.00 NYN 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
OH 618.0 0.20 154.95 YNN 618.00 -0.98 0.46 -0.98 0.03 0.03 MSS
OH 1,629.0 0.40 164.35 YNN 1,628.98 -5.97 2.16 -5.97 0.02 0.02 MSS
OH 2,693.0 0.50 240.75 YNN 2,692.96 -11.82 -0.89 -11.82 0.05 0,01 MSS
OH 3,823.0 0.60 71.65 YNN 3,822.94 -12.37 0.42 -12.37 0.10 0.01 MSS
OH 4,353.0 1.60 192.35 YNN 4,352.88 -18.72 1.47 -18.72 0.37 0.19 MSS
OH 4,962.0 2.10 205.35 YNN 4,961.56 -37,11 -5.12 -37.11 0.11 0.08 MSS
OH 5,935.0 4.20 209.55 YNN 5,933.04 -84.22 -30.33 -84.22 0.22 0.22 MSS
OH 6,426.0 4.20 204.95 YNN 6,422.72 -116.16 -46.78 -116.16 0.07 0.00 MSS
OH 6,682.0 4.10 205.35 YNN 6,678.05 -132.93 -54.66 -132.93 0.04 -0.04 MSS
OH 7,200.0 6.00 209.05 YNN 7,194.01 -173.34 -75.73

-173.34 0.37 0.37 MSS
OH 7,297.0 5.80 207.05 YNN 7,290.50 -182.14 -80.42 -182.14 0.30 -0.21 MSS
OH 7,485.0 6.00 211.45 YNN 7,477.51 -198.98 -89.87 -198.98 0.26 0.11 MSS
QH 7,980.0 7.20 205.75 YNN 7,969.22 -248.99 -116.85 -248.99 0.28 0.24 MSS
OH 8,254.0 7.60 207.20 YNN 8,240.94 -280.57

-132.59 -280.57 0.16 0.15 MSS
OH 8,254.0 7.60 207.20 YNN 8,240.94 -280.57 -132.59 -280.57 0.00 0.00 MWD
OH 8,319.0 6.60 205.50 YNN 8,305.44 -287.77

-136.16| -287.77 1.57 -1.54 MWD
OH 8,384.0 5.40 207.90 YNN 8,370.08 -293.84 -139.20 -293.84 1.89 -1.85 MWD
OH 8,449.0 4.90 207.80| YNN 8,434.82 -299.00

-141.93 -299.00 0.77 -0.77 MWD
OH 8,514.0 4.50 204.40 YNN 8,499.60 -303.78 -144.27 -303,78 0.75 -0.62 MWD
OH 8,587.0 4.60 205.90 YNN 8,572.37 -309.02 -146.74 -309.02 0.21 0.14 MWD
OH 8,620.0 4.40 206.90 YNN 8,605.27 -311.34 -147.89 -311.34 0.65 -0.61 MWD
OH 8,652.0 4.20 206.90 YNN 8,637.18 -313.48 -148.97 -313.48 0.63 -0.63 MWD
OH 8,685.0 3.60 206.30 YNN 8,670.10 -315.49 -149.98 -315,49 1.82 -1.82 MWD
OH 8,750.0 1.80 203.20 YNN 8,735.03 -318.25 -151.28 -318.25 2.78 -2.77 MWO
OH 8,782.0 2.40 204.10 YNN 8,767.01 -319.33 -151.76

-319.33 1.88 1.88 MWD
OH 8,879.0 4.70 198.00 YNN 8,863.81 -324.96 -153.81

-324.96 2.40 2.37! MWO
OH 8,911.0 5.20 198.20 YNN 8,895.70 -327.59 -154.67 -327.59 1.56 1.56 MWD
OH 8,944.0 4.60 198.80 YNN 8,928.57 -330.26 -155.56 -330.26 1.82 -1.82 MWD
OH 8,976,0 3.90 201.10 YNN 8,960.49 -332.49 -156.37

-332.49 2.25 -2.19 MWD
OH 9,009.0 3.30 203.20 YNN 8,993.42 -334.41 -157.15 -334.41 1.86 -1.82 MWD
OH 9,041.0 2.60 208.20 YNN 9,025.38 -335.90 -157.85 -335.90 2.33 -2.19 MWD
OH 9,073.0 2.20 209.90 YNN 9,057.35 -337.07 -158.50 -337.07 1.27 -1.25 MWD

Printed: 1/8/2009 12;SS:46
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Deviation Summary
Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Location: 20- 14-8 20-E 8 srr # v.s. Azt (°)
TMD:12,573.0 (ft) TVD:12,555.48 (ft) Spud Date: 5/3/2008 OH 0.00Closure Distance: 449.1 (ft) Closure Direc ion: 206.54 (°) Calculation Method: MinimumCurvature
S/T # TMD Angle Azimuth CTM TVD N/-S El-W Vert Section DLS BUR Type

(ft) (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°/100ft) (°/100ft)
OH 9,106.0 1.70 223.30 YNN 9,090.33 -337.97 -159.15

-337.97 2.04 -1.52 MWD
OH 9,138.0 1.50 232.30 YNN 9,122.32 -338.57 -159.81 -338.57 1.00 -0.63 MWD
OH 9,170.0 1.80 234.30 YNN 9,154.31 -339.12 -160.55

-339.12 0.95 0.94 MWD
OH 9,203.0 1.90 221.10 YNN 9,187.29 -339.84 -161.33 -339.84 1.32 0.30 MWD
OH 9,235.0 1.80 208.40 YNN 9,219.27 -340.68

-161.92 -340.68 1.32 -0.31 MWD
OH 9,268.0 1.90 199.30 YNN 9,252.25 -341.65 -162.35 -341.65 0.94 0.30 MWD
OH 9,300.0 1.60 192.30 YNN 9,284.24 -342.59; -162.62 -342.59 1.15 -0.94 MWD
OH 9,333.0 1.80 196.40 YNN 9,317.23 -343.54 ¡ -162.86 -343.54 0.71 0.61 MWD
OH 9,365.0 2.40 194.00 YNN 9,349.20 -344.67

-163.17 -344.67 1.89 1.88 MWD
OH 9,399.0 3.10 192.20 YNN 9,383.16 -346.26 -163.53 -346.26 2.07 2.06 MWD
OH 9,432.0 3.70 185.20 YNN 9,416.11 -348.19 -163.82 -348.19 2.21 1.82 MWD
OH 9,464.0 4.10 181.80 YNN 9,448.03 -350.36 -163.95 -350.36 1.44 1.25 MWD
OH 9,497.0 4.00 176.80 YNN 9,480.95 -352.69 -163.92 -352.69 1.11 -0.30 MWD
OH 9,516.0 4.10 176.30 YNN 9,499.90 -354.03 -163.84 -354.03 0.56 0.53 MWD
OH 9,548.0 3.80 170.90 YNN 9,531.83 -356.22 -163.60 -356.22 1.49 -0.94 MWD
OH 9,580.0 3.40 180.00 YNN 9,563.76 -358.22 -163.43 -358.22 2.18 -1.25 MWD
OH 9,613.0 2.90 195,60 YNN 9,596.71 -360.00

-163.65 -360.00 2.99 -1.52 MWD
OH 9,645.0 2.40 210.40 YNN 9,628.68 -361.36 -164.21 -361.36 2.64 -1.56 MWD
OH 9,678.0 2.20 217.30 YNN 9,661.65 -362.46 -164.94 -362.46 1.03 -0.61 MWD
OH 9,710.0 2.20 214.30 YNN 9,693.63 -363.45 -165.66

-363.45, 0.36| 0.00 MWD
QH 9,743.0 2.60 216.00 YNN 9,726,60 -364.58 -166.46

-364.58 1.23 1.21 MWD
OH 9,775.0 2.40 216.60 YNN 9,758.57 -365.71

-167.29 -365.71 0.63 -0.63 MWO
OH 9,808.0 2.80 213.50 YNN 9,791.54 -366.93 -168.14 -366.93 1.28 1.21 MWD
OH 9,840.0 2.60 208.80 YNN 9,823.50 -368.22 -168.92 -368.22 0.93 -0.63 MWD
OH 9,873.0 2.30 205.10 YNN 9,856.47 -369.48

-169.56 -369.48 1.03 -0.91 MWD
OH 9,905.0 2.30 204.50 YNN 9,888.45 -370.64 -170.10 -370.64 0.08 0.00 MWD
OH 9,938.0 2.60 207.50 YNN 9,921.42 -371.91 -170.72 -371.91 0.99 0.91 MWD
OH 9,970.0 2.70 212.10 YNN 9,953.38 -373.19 -171.46 -373.19 0.73 0.31 MWD
OH 10,003.0 2.70 218.20 YNN 9,986.34 -374.46

-172.35 -374.46 0.87 0.00 MWD
OH 10,035.0 2.30 219.20 YNN 10,018.31 -375.55

-173.22 -375,55 1.26 -1.25 MWD
OH 10,067.0 1.60 219.40 YNN 10,050.30 -376.39 -173.91 -376.39 2.19 -2.19 MWD
OH 10,100.0 1.20 213.60 YNN 10,083.29 -377.04

-174.40 -377.04 1.28 -1.21 MWD
OH 10,132.0 1.60 209.40 YNN 10,115.28 -377.70 -174.80 -377.70 1.29 1.25 MWD

Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35:46



Questar E &P ge 3 of 4

Deviation Summary
Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Location: 20- 14-8 20-E 8 S/T # V.S. AZI (°)
TMD:12,573.0 (ft) TVD: 12,555.48 (ft) Spud Date: 5/3/2008 os o.coClosure Distance: 449.1 (ft) Closure Direction:206.54 (°) Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
S/T # TMD Angle Azimuth CTM TVD N/-S El-W Vert. Section DLS BUR Type

(ft) (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°/100ft) (°/100ft)
OH 10,165.0 2.10 206.60 YNN 10,148.26 -378.65

-175.30 -378.65 1.54 1.52 MWD
OH 10,197.0 2.20 209.10 YNN 10,180.24 -379.71 -175.86 -379.71 0.43 0.31 MWD
OH 10,229.0 2.10 209.00 YNN 10,212.21 -380.76 -176.44 -380.76 0.31 -0.31 MWD
OH 10,262.0 2.10 205.50 YNN 10,245.19 -381.83 -177.00 -381.83 0.39 0.00 MWO
OH 10,294.0 2.00 201.80 YNN 10,277.17 -382.88 -177.46 -382.88 0.52 -0.31 MWD
QH 10,327.0 2.20 198.10 YNN 10,310.15 -384.02 -177.87 -384.02 0.73 0.61 MWD
OH 10,359.0 2.30 194.40 YNN 10,342.12 -385.22 -178.22 -385.22 0.55 0.31 MWO
OH 10,392.0 2.40 198.00 YNN 10,375.10 -386.52 -178.60 -386.52 0.54 0.30 MWD
OH 10,424,0 2.40 198.90 YNN 10,407.07 -387.79 -179.02 -387.79 0.12 0.00 MWD
OH 10,456.0 2.60 203.80 YNN 10,439.04 -389.09 -179.53 -389.09 0.91 0.63 MWD
OH 10,489.0 2.50 207.40 YNN 10,472.00 -390.41 -180.16 -390.41 0.57 -0.30 MWO
OH 10,521.0 2.00 204.10 YNN 10,503.98 -391.54 -180.71 -391.54 1.61 -1.56 MWD
OH 10,554.0 1.50 195.50 YNN 10,536.96 -392.48 -181.06 -392.48 1.71 -1.52 MWD
OH ! 10,586.0 1.40 194.20 YNN 10,568.95 -393.27 -181.27 -393.27 0.33 -0.31 MWOOH 10,619.0 1.00 183.60 YNN 10,601.95 -393.94 -181.39 -393.94 1.38 -1.21 MWD
OH 10,651.0 1.30 184.90 YNN 10,633.94 -394.58 -181.44 -394.58 0.94 0.94 MWO
OH 10,683.0 1.60 185.40 YNN 10,665.93 -395.39 -181.51 -395.39 0.94 0.94 MWD
OH 10,716.0 1.70 198.30 YNN 10,698.92 -396.31 -181.71 -396.31 1.16 0.30 MWD
OH 10,758,0 2.10 216.00 YNN 10,740.89 -397.53 -182.35 -397.53 1.68 0.95 MWD
OH 10,781.0 2.50 218.10 YNN 10,763.88 -398.26 -182.91 -398.26 1.78 1.74 MWD
OH 10,813.0 2.10 224.60 YNN 10,795.85 -399.23 -183.75 -399.23 1.49 -1.25 MWD
OH 10,845.0 1.10 236.80 YNN 10,827.84 -399.82

-184.42 -399.82 3.28 -3.13 MWD
OH 10,878.0 0.40 282.10 YNN 10,860.83 -399.97 -184.80 -399.97 2.63 -2.12 MWD
OH 10,910.0 0.40 345.90 YNN 10,892.83 -399.83

-184.94 -399.83 1.32 0.00 MWDOH 10,943.0 0.40 7.90 YNN 10,925.83 -399.61 -184.95 -399,61 0.46 0.00 MWD
OH 10,975.0 0.10 20.00 YNN 10,957.83 -399.47 -184.92 -399.47 0.95 -0.94 MWD
OH 11,008.0 0.10 38.50 YNN 10,990.83 -399.42 -184.90 -399.42 0.10 0.00 MWD
OH 11,008.0 0.10 38.50 YNN 10,990.83 -399.42 -184.90 -399.42 0.00 0.00 MWD
OH 11,040.0 0.10 153.80 YNN 11,022.83 -399.43 -184.87 -399.43 0.53 0.00 MWD
OH 11,054.0 0.20 169.90 YNN 11,036,83 -399.46 -184.86 -399.46 0.77 0.71 MWDOH 11,067.0 0.30 180.80 YNN 11,049.83 -399.52 -184.85

-399.52 0.85 0.77 MWDOH 11,100.0 0.40 195.80 YNN 11,082.83 -399.71 -184.89 -399.71 0.41 0.30 MWDOH 11,132.0 0.60 194.00 YNN 11,114.83 -399.98 -184.96 -399.98 0.63 0.63 MWD
I I

Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35:4
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Deviation Summary
Well Name: FR 6P-20-14-20 Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 s/T # v.s.AZI ( )TMD: 12,573.0 (ft) TVD:12,555.48 (ft) Spud Date: 5/3/2008 OH 0.00Closure Distance: 449.1 (ft) Closure Direction: 200.54 (°) Calculation Method: MinimumCurvature
S/T # TMD Angle Azimuth CTM TVD N/-S El-W Vert. Section DLS BUR e(ft) (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°/100ft) (°/100ft)
OH 11,162.0 0.80 192.40; YNN 11,144.83 -400.34 -185.04

-400.34 0.67 0.67 MWDOH 11,197.0 0.90 141.80 YNN 11,179.82 -400.80 -184.92 -400.80 2.09 0.29 MWDOH 11,230.0 1.20 195.90 YNN 11,212.82 -401.33 -184.86
-401.33 3.00 0.91 MWOOH 11,266.0 1.60 203.60 YNN 11,248.81 -402.15 -185.16 -402.15 1.23 1.11 MWDOH 11,299.0 2.30 207.50 YNN 11,281.79 -403.16 -185.65 -403.16 2.16 2.12 MWDOH 11,331.0 1.80 210.30 YNN 11,313.77 -404.17 -186.20 -404.17 1.59 -1.56 MWDOH 11,364.0 1.30 222.80 YNN 11,346.76 -404.89 -186.72 -404.89 1.82 -1.52 MWDOH 11,396.0 1.10 223.40 YNN 11,378.75 -405.38 -187.18

-405.38 0.63 -0.63 MWDOH 11,429,0 0.60 252.00 YNN 11,411.75 -405.66 -187.56
-405.66 1.94 -1.52 MWDOH 11,461.0 0.70 301.60 YNN 11,443.74 -405.61 -187.88
-405.61 1.73 0.31 MWDOH 11,493.0 0.50 323.90 YNN 11,475.74 -405.40 -188.13
-405.40 0.95 -0.63 MWOOH 11,526.0 0.60 274.60 YNN 11,508.74 -405.27 -188.39
-405.27 1.42 0.30 MWDOH 11,558.0 0.90 228.80 YNN 11,540.74 -405.42 -188.74
-405.42 2.02 0,94 MWDOH 11,591.0 1.70 205.50 YNN 11,573.73 -406.03 -189.15

-406.03 2.86 2.42 MWDOH 11,623.0 2.50 200.00 YNN 11,605.71 -407.12 -189.59
-407.12 2.58 2.50 MWDOH 11,654.0 2.50 197.90 YNN 11,636.68 -408.39 -190.03 -408.39 0.30 0.00 MWDOH 11,686.0 1.70 198.50 YNN 11,668.66 -409.51 I -190.40 -409.51 2.50 -2.50 MWDOH 11,719.0 0.60 220.90 YNN 11,701.65 -410.10 -190.67

-410.10 3.54 -3.33 MWOOH 11,745.0 0.90 207.70 YNN 11,727.65 -410.39 -190.85
-410.39 1.32 1.15 MWDOH 11,777.0 1.10 221.00 YNN 11,759.64 -410.84 -191.17
-410.84 0.95 0.63 MWDOH 11,810.0 0.40 273.50 YNN 11,792.64 -411.07 -191.49
-411.07 2.77 -2.12 MWDOH 11,848.0 0.20 335.70 YNN i 11,830.64 -411.01 -191.65
-411.01 0.93 -0.53 MWDOH 11,881.0 0.30 310.90 YNN 11,863.64 -410.90 -191.74
-410.90 0.44 0.30 MWDOH 11,913.0 0.40 327.10 YNN 11,895.64 -410.75 -191.86 -410.75 0.44 0.31 MWDOH 11,945.0 0.50 327.90 YNN 11,927.64 -410.54 -192.00
-410.54 0.31 0.31 MWDOH 11,978.0 0.50 307.90 YNN 11,960.64 -410.32 -192.19
-410.32 0.53 0.00 MWDOH 12,010.0 0.50 350.10 YNN 11,992.64 -410.10 -192.32
-410.10 1.12 0.00 MWD

OH 12,043.0 0.90 351.00 YNN 12,025.63 -409,70 -192.39
-409.70 1.21 1.21 MWO

QH 12,075.0 0.90 347.30 YNN 12,057.63 -409.21 -192.48
-409.21 0.18 0.00 MWDOH 12,107.0 1.10 345.50 YNN 12,089.62 -408.67 -192.62
-408.67 0.63 0.63 MWDOH 12,123.0 1.10 353.30 YNN 12,105.62 -408.37 -192.67
-408.37 0.94 0.00 MWDOH 12,573.0 2.00 286.95 YNN 12,5g5 48 -401.79 -200.69 -401.79 0.41 0.20 MSS

Printed: 1/0/2009 12:35:46
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Operations Summary Report - Ì LLJANG

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-8 20-E 8 Rig Release: 7/31/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours code Description of operations
5/4/2008 06:00 -11:30 5.50 LOC 2 DRILL 30" CONDUCTORTO 90' SET20" CONDUCTQR PIPE DRILLMOUSE

HOLE TO 80' MICHAEL LEE NOTIFIED OF SPUD 12:54, 5/28/2008
11:30 -01:30 14.00 DRL 9 DRILL 15 1/2" SURFACE HOLE F/90' TO 539' TD FOR SURFACE
01:30 -02:30 1.00 TRP 3 TRIP OUT TO RUN 10 3/4" CASING LAYDOWN DRILL STRING
02:30 -04:30 2.00 CSG 2 RUN 12 JTS OF 10 3/4", #40.5, J-55, ST&C CASING SET AT 520' GL
04:30 -06:00 1.50 CMT 2 CEMENT, PUMPED 70 BBLS OF WATER, 20 BBLS OF GEL WATER AND 88

BBLS OF †5.8 PPG 430 SKS OF CEMENT DISPLACED WITH 46.5 BBLS OF
WATER. 10 BBLS OF RETURNS TO PITS FLOAT HELD. CALLEDJAMIE
SPARGER WITH BLM ON CEMENT JOB

6/12/2008 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG DOWN TOP DRIVE UNABLETO BREAK CONNECTIONS FOR LOAD PATH
INSPECTION, GENERAL RIG DOWN

18:00 -06:00 12.00 OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
6/13/2008 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG DOWN LAYOVER DERRICK UNSTRING BLOCKS PREPARE FOR TRUCKS

18:00 -06:00 12.00 OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
6/14/2008 06:00-18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG DOWN ALLWATER AND ELETRICAL LINES DRAIN WATER TANKS WORK

ON SHAKERS PREPARE FOR TRUCKS
18:00 -06:00 12.00 OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

6/15/2008 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 3 MOVE FROM SCS5C TO FR6P USING PlPE LINE ROAD, RIG MOVE 50%, RIG
DOWN 80%, WILL STORE 41/2" DRILLSTRING ON FR7P OKAYED BY
JOHANNA WILL HAVE TO WATER ROADS FOR DUST CONTROLL

6/16/2008 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 GET DERRICK OFF FLOOR, BREAK DOWN SUB, WE ARE PULLING EVERY
LOADUP HILLON FLATROCK SIDE RIG MOVE 75%, RIG DOWN 100%

6/17/2008 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG MOVE 85% - RIG UP 10%, SET MATTING BOARDS & SUB
18:00 -06:00 12.00 OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT - WILL MOVE CAMPS TODAY

6/18/2008 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 90% RIG MOVE &50% RIG UP, STACK BOP, SET UPPER SUB, FLOOR
MOTORS, DRAWWORKS, SHAKER & INTERMEDIATE MUD TANKS & 1 MIUD
PUMP. WILL MOVE DERRICK TODAY

18:00 -06:00 12.00 OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHTS

- NOTE: ESTIMATE OFF SCS 5C LOCATION THURSDAY EVE 6/19/2008
6/19/2008 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 95% RIG MOVE &70% RIG UP, SET #2 MUD PUMP, SUCTION TANK,

BACKYARD,TOP DOG HOUSES, GAS BUSTER & FLARE BOX. DERRICK ON
LOCATION

18:00 -06:00 12.00 OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: SHOULD BE OFF SCS 5C LOCATION FRIDAY, 6120/2008-2 STRINGS

TUBULARS LEFT
6/20/2008 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 97% RIG MOVE & 90% RIG UP, POWER WASH ÐERRICK, PIN & SET ON

FLOOR. SET HOPPER HOUSE & SOLIDS EQUIPMENT (MODIFYINGCHOKE
LINE & BLOOIE LINE BECAUSE OF HEIGHT DIFFERNENCE IN WELL HEAD)

18:00 -06:00 12.00 OTH WAIT ON DA¥LIGHT
- NOTE: UNITMECHANIC BROUGHT OUT NEW BRAKE BANDS FOR

DRAWWORKS, NOT CORRECT BANDS. BRAKE PADS FOR OLD BANÐS
SHOULD BE ON LOCATION TODAY, 6/20/2008. WILL BE OFF SCS 5C
LOCATION TODAY 6/20/2008. WILLBREAK TOWER TODAY 6120/2008.

6/21/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 LOC 4 STRING UP, STRESS TEST DERRICK& RAISE DERRICK, HANG BACK BRIDLE
LINE, RIG UP FLOOR & INSTALLCHOKE, PANIC, FLARE& BLOOlE LINES

- NOTE: WEATHERFORD AIRPACKAGE SCHEDULED ON LOCATION THIS AM.
CRANE RELEASED @ 1000 HRS, 4LOADS TUBULARS LEFT TO UNLOAD.
NOTIFIED BILLOWEN g 0945 HRS W/ BLMOF INTENT TO TEST BOP & DRILL
INTERMEDIATE. NOTIFIED RACHEL @ 1330 HRS W/ UTAH OIL & GAS OF
INTENT

6/22/2008 D6:00 -01:00 19.00 LOC 4 100% RIG UP, PlCK UP & HANG TORQUE TUBE, PICK UP SWIVEL & TOP
DRIVE, LOAD PATH INSPECTION BY TESCO, HANG SERVICE LOOP, SET IN

Map¶¶!ygg lip¶µed: 116/2009



Questar E & P Page 2 of 9

Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release: 7/31/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date Frotn - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

6/22/2008 06:00-01:00 19.00 LOC 4 WEATHERFORD AIR PACKAGE
01:00 -06:00 5.00 BOP 2 TEST BOP & CHOKE Wl250 PSI LOW & 5000 PSI HIGH
06:00 - NOTE: WEATHERFORD SHORT HARD LINE. WHEN OFF LOADINGBOOSTER

PUMP FOUND 3" CRACK IN ENGINE BLOCK ABOVE OIL PAN. NEW BOOSTER
ETA TODAY. HARD LINETHIS AM.

6/23/2008 06:00 -09:00 3.00 BOP 2 TEST BOP W/ B&C QUICK TEST. UPPER & LOWER PIPE RAMS, BLINDRAMS,
CHOKE & KILLLINE, CHOKE MANIFOLD, FLOOR VALVES & DOUBLEBALLF/
TOP DRIVE Wl250PSI LOW & 5000 PSI HIGH. TEST ANNULARW/ 2500 PSI.
TEST KELLYHOSE. STANDPIPE & MUD LINES Wl250 PSI LOW & 3000 PSI
HIGH. TEST SURFACE CASING W/ 1500 PSI F/ 30 MIN.

09:00 -14:00 5.00 OTH PULL DRAWWORKS BRAKE BANDS & INSTALLNEW BRAKE PADS, INSTALL
BANÐS

14:00-17:00 3.00 OTH FINISH LAYlNGOUT BHA& STRAP. INSTALL SERVICE LOOP TARP
17:00-18:00 1.00 OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
18:00 - 20:30 2.50 TRP i M/U 9-7/8" BIT #1 &TIH PICKING UP BHA
20:30 -21:00 0.50 OTH TEST WEATHERFORD AIRLINES W/ 1500 PSI
21:00 -00:00 3.00 TRP f TIH PICKING UP BHA
00:00-00:30 0.50 OTH 1NSTALLROTATING HEAD RUBBER
00:30 -01:30 1.00 OTH BLOW HOLE DRY (10" VALVEON FLOW LINE LEAKING, TIGHTEN BOLTS)
01:30-03:30 2.00 DRL 4 DRILL CEMENT, FLOAT EQUlPMENT & CEMENT POCKET FI453' TO 539'
03:30 -04:30 1.00 DRL 1 DRILL9-7/8" HOLEW/ AIR F/ 539' TO 628', WOB 18K, ROT 70, 2900 CFM, 225 PSI

(DUSTING)
04:30 -05:00 0.50 SUR 1 WIRELINE SURVEY @618' UNABLETO RETRIEVE SURVEY TOOL
05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RETRIEVE SURVEY TOOL

6/24/2008 06:00-07:00 1.00 TRP 2 TOOH
07:00 -08:00 1.00 OTH RETRIEVE SURVEY, CROWSFOOT WEDGED AGAINST SURVEY TOOL
08:00 - 10:00 2.00 TRP 2 TlH W/ BIT # 1. P/U 3 - 6-1/2" DC
10:00 -16:30 6.50 DRL 1 DRILL FI 628' TO 995', WOB 18-20K, RT 70, CFM 2900, PSI 225 (DUSTING)
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
17:00 -02:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILL Fl995' TO 1636', WOB 18-20K, RT 70, CFM 2900, PSI 300 ( WATER SAND

@1238', START MISTING @1490'-9GPM)
02:30 -03:00 0.50 SUR 1 WIRELINE SURVEY @1629' =

.4 INC & 164.35 AZ
03:00 -04:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 1636' TO 1826', WOB 20-22K, ROT 70, CFM 2900, PSI 310, MIST 9 GPM
04:00-06:00 2.00 OTH TOTAL TIME CONNECTIONS & REGAIN CIRCULATION

6/25/2008 06:00 - 12:30 6.50 i DRL 1 DRILL Fl 1826' TO 2117, WOB 25-30K, ROT 70, CFM 2900, PSI 330 MIST 9 GPM
(MAKINGWATER)

12:30-13:00 0.50 RIG i RIGSERVICE
13:00 - 18:30 5.50 DRL 1 DRILL Fl2117' TO 250T, WOB 30K, ROT 75, CFM 2900, PSI 430 MIST 9 GPM

(MAKINGWATER}
18:30 -19:00 0.50 OTH REPAR HOLE IN FLOW LINE
19:00 -22:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL F12507 TO 2701', WOB 30K, ROT 75, CFM 2900, PSI 490 MIST 9 GPM

(MAKING WATER)
22:00 -23:00 1.00 SUR 1 WIRELINE SURVEY @2693' =

.5 INC & 240.75 AZ
23:00 -03:00 4.00 DRL i DRILL Fl2701' TO 3050', WOB 30K, ROT 75, CFM 2900, SPM 50, 132 GPM PSI

660 (DRILLW/ AIREATED FLUID@0030 HRS
03:00-06:00 3.00 OTH CONNECTIONS&REGAINCIRCULATION

6/26/2008 06:00 -09:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 3050' TO 3171', WOB 30K, ROT 75, CFM 2900, PS 50, GPM 132, PSI 660
09:00-09:30 0.50 RIG 2 REPAIR WEATHERFORD MIST PUMP
09:30 -11:30 2.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 3171' TO 3285', WOB 30-35K, ROT 80, CFM 2900, PS 50, GPM 132, PSI

660
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:00 -15:00 3.00 OTH TOTAL TIME CONNECTIONS & REGAlN CIRCULATION WI AIR
15:00 -03:00 12 00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 3285' TO 3832', WOB 35-40K, ROT 80, CFM 2900, PS 65, GPM 171, PSi

Printed: 1/6/2009 1:32:27
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release: 7/31/2008
Rig Name: UN1T Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours Cocle CSu Description of Operations

6/26/2008 15:00 -03:00 12.00 DRL 1 715 (1900 HRS START REDUCING AIR & INCREASING PUMP STROKES TO
MAINTAINRESERVE PIT LEVEL)

03:00 -04:30 1.50 CIRC i PUMP 20 BBL SWEEP. PUMP 800 BBL FLUID INTO FORMATION W/ PUMPS @
527GPM-NOAIR

04:30 -06:00 1.50 TRP 14 SHORT TRIP TO SHOE - SLM
6/27/2008 06:00 -09:30 3.50 TRP 15 FINISH SHORT TRIP TO SHOE SK MAXOVER PULL & TIH (SLM-NO CHANGE)

09:30 -11:30 2.00 CIRC 1 PUMP SWEEP, CIRCULATE & CONDITION TO RUN CASING
11:30-12:00 0.50 SUR 1 WIRELINESURVEY
12:00 -14:30 2.50 TRP 2 TOOH TO RUN CASING
14:30 - 15:30 1.00 TRP i LAYDOWN 6-112" &8" DRILLCOLLARS
15:30 -17:00 L50 OTH CLEAN FLOOR, PULL WEAR BUSHING, CHANGE OUT BAILS& ELEVATORS

17:00 -19:00 2.00 CSG 1 RIG UP FRANKS CASING CREW, HOLD SAFETY MEETING
19:00 -23:00 4.00 CSG 2 RUN 22 JTS7-5/8", 29.7#, P110, LT&CCASING
23:00 -23:30 0.50 RIG 2 REPAIR HYORAUUC LEAKTO DOUBLE BALLVALVETOP DRIVE
23:30 -03:00 3.50 CSG 2 RUN 59 JTS CASING TOTAL 81 JTS, SHOE @3812', FLOAT COLLAR @3718.6'

03:00 -04:00 1.00 CSG 2 LAND MANDRIL&BREAK CtRCULATION
04:00 -06:00 2.00 OTH RID FRANKS, PACKOFF WELLHEAD & TEST Wl5000 PSI

6/28/2008 06:00 -10:30 4.50 CMT 2 SPOT PUMP TRUCKS &WAIT ON HALLIBURTONNITROGENTRUCKS

10:30 -14:00 3.50 CMT 1 SPOT N2 TRUCKS & RIG UP HALLIBURTON
14:00 -18:30 4.50 CMT 2 SAFETY MEETING, TEST CEMENT LINES TO 6000 PSI N2 LINES TO 9000 PSI,

PUMP 10 BBL FOAMED WATER, 20 BBL FOAMED SUPER FLUSH, 20 BBL
FOAMEDWATER, PUMP 91 BBL 345 SKS YIELD1.48 FOAMED DENSITY 8.5
LB/GAL, PUMP FOAMED TAILCEMENT @5 BBL/MIN 80 BBL305 SKS, PUMP
UNFOAMED TAIL@43.5 BBL 165 SKS, 14.3 LB/GAL. DROP PLUGDISPLACE W/
169.2 BBLWATER, BUMP MPLUG Wl1300 PSI, FLOATS HELD W/ 1.TBBL
BACK, NO RETURNS DURING ENTIRE JOB, PUMP CAP CEMENT55 BBL, 200
SKS @14.6 LB/GAL

18:30 -19:30 1.00 CMT 1 RIG DOWN CEMENTERS(NOTIFIED @2100 HRS BY ENGINEER SEAN JONES

& CEMENTER CHRIS THAT VALVES ON "A" SECTION WERE CLOSED DURING
CEMENTJOB)

19:30 -22:00 2.50 OTH REPAIR FLOW LINE, CHANGE OUT BAILS& ELEVATORS & CLEAN FLOOR

22:00 -00:00 2.00 OTH INSTALLWEARBUSHING, STRAP & PICK UP BHA
00:00 -03:30 3.50 TRP 2 M/U BIT #2 & TlH TO 3650'
03:30 -04:30 1.00 OTH TEST CASING WI 1500 PSI
04:30 -05:00 0.50 TRP 2 TlH TO 3670', TAG CEMENT STRINGERS
05:00-06:00 1.00 DRL 4 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT

6/29/2008 06:00 -06:30 0.50 DRL 4 DRILL FLOAT EQUIPMENT & CEMENT POCKET TO 3832'

06:30 -07:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRILL6-1/2" HOLE W/ .46MUD MOTOR & PDC BIT F/ 3832' TO 3845', WOB 6K,
ROT 10, RPM 110, PS 80, PP 1000

07:00 -07:30 0.50 EQT 2 FIT W/ 8.45# AMW&722 PSI = 12.06# EMW
07:30 - 14:30 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 3845' TO 4030', WOB 6-13K, ROT 10, RPM 115, PS 85, PP 1100 (3904'

TO 3970', ROP 14.6 FT/HR - WOB 6-24K)
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:00 -22:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL Fl4030' TO 4419', WOB 7-15K, ROT 10, RPM 115, PS 85, PP 1200

22:00 -22:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRELINE SURVEY @4353' = 1.6 INC & 192.35 AZ
22:30 -04:00 5.50 ÐRL 1 ÐRILL F/ 44t9' TO 4938', WOB 6-16K, ROT 10, RPM 115, PS 85, PP 1310

04:00 -06:00 2.00 OTH TOTAL TIME F/ COlNNECTIONS
6/30/2008 06:00 -08:30 2.50 DRL i DRILL FI4938' TO 50t9', WOB &28K, ROT 10, RPM 115, PS 85, PP 1425

08:30 -09:30 1.00 CIRC 1 DROP SURVEY & PUMP DRY SLUG
09:30 - 12:30 3.00 TRP 2 TOOH W/ BIT#2 (WET)
12:30 -13:30 1.00 OTH RETRIEVE SURVEY, CHANGE OUT BIT& MUD MOTOR (3 JET NOZZLES

PLUGGED)
13:30 - 14:30 1.00 TRP 2 SURFACE TEST MUD MOTOR &TlH W/ BIT # 3 & .26 MUD MOTOR

Printed: 1/6/2009 1:32:27
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release: 7/31/2008
Rig Name: UNiT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

6/30/2008 14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
15:00 - 16:30 1.50 TRP 2 TlH TO 4938'
16:30 -17:30 1.00 RIG 2 TOTAL TIME ON TRIP ATTEMPTING TO REPAIR SMITH TRU TORQUE
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM F/ 4938' TO 5019' (PRECAUTIONARY)
18:00 -04:30 10.50 DRL i DRILLF/5019' TO 5794'. WOB 10-12K. ROT 40. RPM 110, PS 100, PP 1450
04:30 -06:00 1 50 OTH TOTAL TIME FI CONNECTIONS

7/1/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/5794' TO 5878'. WOB 10-12K, ROT 40, RPM 110, PS 100, PP 1475
07:30 -08:00 0.50 SUR 1 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 5841' = MISS RUN
08:00 -10:00 2.00 DRL i DRILL F/5878' TO 5975'.WOB 10-12K. ROT 40, RPM 110, PS 100, PP 1500
10:00 -10:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRELINESURVEY@ 5935' = 4.2 INC & 209.55 AZ
10:30 - 13:30 3.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 5975' TO 6070', WOB 10-12K, ROT 40, RPM 110, PS 100, PP 1500
13:30 -14:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE& CHANGE OUT FUEL FILTERS TOP DRIVE
14:00 -23:30 9.50 ÐRL 1 DRILLFl6070' TO 6461', WOB 10-12K, ROT 40, RPM 110, PS 100, PP 1500
23:30 -00:30 1.00 SUR 1 WIRELINE SURVEY @6426' = 4.2 INC & 204.95 AZ
00:30 -04:30 4.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 6461' TO 6655', WOB 10-12K, ROT 10, RPM 75, PS 95, PP 1450
04:30 -06:00 1.50 OTH TOTAL TIME F/ CONNECTIONS

7/2/2008 06:00 - 14:00 8.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/6655' TO 6752' WOB 17, ROT 10, PS 95. PP 1500, MM .26 1/2 HOUR OFF
BIT HOURS FOR CONNECTIONS

14:00 - 14:30 0.50 SUR 1 DROP SURVEY
14:30 - 16:30 2.00 TRP 10 PUMP DRY PIPE PILL AND TRIP OUT BIT #3
16:30 -21:30 5.00 FlSH 6 AT 5375' ON TRIP OUT STUCK DRILLSTRING COULD NOT CIRCULATE AND

JARS WOULD NOT FIRE DOWN,WORKED PIPE AND FIRED JARS UP
ESTABLISHED CIRCULAT10N RAISED MW TO 9.3 PPG HOLE SLUFFING GOT
ROTATION BACK AND CIRCULATE

21:30 - 23:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE WELLBORE FOR SLUFFING SHALES
23:00 -06:00 7.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT BACK REAM EACH STAND AND CIRCULATE OUT TO 4800'

SLUFFING SHALE COULD NOT PULL A STAND WITH OUT PUMP LOTS OF
CUTTING OVER SHAKERS FROM 4800' TO SHOE NO PUMP OR OVER PULL

7/3/2008 06:00 -09:00 3.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT BIT #3, REPLACE JARS AND LAYDOWN IBS
09:00 -09:30 0.50 OTH FUNCTION TEST BOP
09:30 - 14:00 4.50 TRP 10 TRIP IN BIT #4 AND .26 MUD MOTOR
14:00 -15:00 1.00 REAM i WASH AND REAMLAST STANDTO BOTTOM 30' FILL
15:00 -05:30 14.50 DRL 1 DRILLF16752' TO 6893' WOB 14-20, ROT 10, PS 95, PP 1537, MM .26

05:30 -06:00 0.50 OTH CONNECTIONS
7/4/2008 06:00 - 14:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/6893' TO 7041' WOB 21, ROT 10, PS 95, PP 1550, MM .26

14:30-15:00 0.50 RIG i RIGSERVICE
15:00 - 17:30 2.50 DRL i DRILLF/7041' TO 7093' WOB 21, ROT 10, PS 95, PP 1550, MM .26

17:30 -18:00 0.50 OTH CONNECTIONS
18:00 -00:00 6.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/7093' TO 7235' WOB 14-21, ROT 10-40, PS 95, PP 1500 DROPPED WOB

AND INCREASED ROTARTY WHEN WE GOT IN MANCOS
00:00 -01:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEY @7200'6INC 209.05 AZMWILLRESURVEY KELLYDOWN NEXT

STAND
01:00 -04:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/7235' TO 7332' WOB 14, ROT 40, PS 95, PP 1500
04:00 -05:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEY @72975.8 INC 207.05 AZM
05:00 -05:30 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/7332' TO 7374' WOB 14, ROT 40, PS 95, PP 1500
05:30-06:00 0.50 OTH CONNECTIONS

7/5/2008 06:00 - 12:00 6.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/7374' TO 750T WOB 17, ROT 40, PS 95, PP 1450, MM .26

12:00 -12:30 0.50 SUR 1 DROP SURVEY
12:30 -17:30 5.00 TRP 10 TRIPOUT BIT#4 FIRST 43 STDS HAD TO BE BACKREAMED
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 OTH FUNCTION TEST BOP
18:00 - 22:00 4.00 TRP 10 PfCK UP .46 MUD MOTOR AND TRIP IN TAGGED AT 6800'
22:00 -02:00 4.00 REAM 1 WASH AND REAMF16800' TO 7507
02:00 -05:30 3.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/7507 TO 7786' WOB 8, ROT 20 PS 95, PP 1650, MM .46

i VIRAF9% Printed: 1Æl2009



Questar E & P Page 5 of 9

Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release: 7/31/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

7/5/2008 05:30 -06:00 0.50 OTH CONNECTIONS
7/6/2008 06:00 -09:30 3.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/7786' TO 8013' WOB 9, ROT 20, PS 95, PP 1570, MM .46

09:30 - 10:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE FOR SURVEY
10:00 - 11:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEY @7980'7.2 INC 205.75 AZM
11:00 -13:30 2.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/8013' TO 8303' WOB 8, ROT 50 PS 95, PP 1570, MM .46

13:30 - 14:30 1.00 OTH CONNECTIONS
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 SUR 1 SURVEY @8270' 7.8 INC 208.75 AZM
16:00 -06:00 14.00 WOT 4 WAIT ON DIRECTIONAL TOOLS, WIPER TRIP 16 STDS AND CIRCULATE

7/7/2008 06:00 -10:30 4.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT TO PICK UP DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS
10:30 -11:00 0.50 TRP 1 LAYDOWN MUD MOTOR AND MONEL
11:00 -13:00 2.00 TRP 1 PICK UP DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS AND ORIENT
13:00 - 15:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP INTO SHOE
15:00-17:00 2.00 RIG 6 SLIPAND CUT DRILLINGUNE AND ADJUST BREAKS
17:00 -20:00 3.00 TRP 2 FINSlH TRIP IN WASH LAST STD TO BOTTOM
20:00 -05:30 9.50 DRL 2 DRILLF/8303' TO 8509' WOB 6, ROT 40. PS 80. PP 1475, SLIDE 10' ROTATE 50'

TO DROP ANGLE
05:30 -06:00 0.50 OTH CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS

7/8/2008 06:00 -10:30 4.50 DRL 2 DRILLF/8509' TO 8615' WOB 7, ROT 40, PS 80, PP 1320, MM .5, SLIDE 10'
ROTATE 20'

10:30 -11:30 1.00 CIRC i GAIN 67 BBLS CIRCULATE GAS THROUGH CHOKE (BALLOONING)
11:30 -18:30 7.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/8615' TO 8734' WOB 7, ROT 40, PS 80, PP 1320, ONE SLIDE 15'

ROTATE 15', SLIDE 20' ROTATE 20'
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 RIG i CHANGE ROTATING RUBBER RIG SERVICE
19:00-21:00 2.00 RIG 2 CHANGEOUTWASHPIPE
21:00 -22:00 1.00 RIG 2 CHANGE SLIP DYES ON 4" SLIPS
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 DRL 2 SLIDE F/8734' 8739'
23:00 -03:30 4.50 RIG 2 WASH PIPE LEAKINGCHANGE OUT WASH PIPE TEST AND LEAKEDREBUILD

WASH PIPE AND CHANGE OUT
03:30 -06:00 2.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F18739' TO 8755'

7/9/2008 06:00 - 12:00 6.00 DRL 2 DRILLF/8755' TO 8929' WOB 8, ROT 40, PS 80, PP 1320, MM .5 SLIDE 20'
ROTATE TEN PER JOINT

12:00 - 12:30 0.50 RIG i RIG SERVICE
12:30 -04:00 15.50 DRL 2 DRILLF/8929' TO 9065' WOB 6, ROT 40, PS 80, PP 1320, MM .5 SLIDE 15

ROTATE 90' BUILT F/2.4 TO 5.2 SLIDE20' ROTATE 10', SLIDE 15 ROTATE 15'
ON EACH JOINT

04:00 -06:00 2.00 OTH CONNECTION & SURVEY
7/10/2008 06:00 -11:30 5.50 DRL 2 DRILL Fl9065' TO 9123' WOB 4, ROT 50, PS 90, PP 1435, MM .5 SUDE 12

ROTATE 18', SLIDE 15'
11:30-12:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
12:00 -04:00 16.00 DRL 2 DRILLFl9123' TO 9318' WOB 4, ROT 50, PS 90, PP 1453, ROTATE 75' SLIDE 10

ROTATE 50' SLIDE TEN ROTATE 20'
04:00-06:00 2.00 OTH CONNECTIONSANDSURVEYS

7/11/2008 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/9318' TO 9416' WOB 4, ROT 40, PS 90, PP 1400, MM .5

10:00-11:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND PUMP DRY PIPE PILL
11:00 - 14:30 3.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT BIT#6
14:30 -15:30 1.00 OTH WORK TIGHT HOLE AT 4443'
15:30-16:30 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT TO HWDP FOR INSPECTION
16:30-21:00 4.50 lŠP 1 INSPECTBHA
21:00 -22:30 1.50 OTH CHANGE BATTERIES IN MWD AND PICK UP NEW BIT
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 OTH FUNCTION TEST BOP
23:00 -02:00 3.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN BIT #7 TIGHT F/4300' TO
02:00 -06:00 4.00 REAM i WASH AND REAM F/4400' TO
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release: 7/31/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

7/12/2008 06:00 -19:00 13.00 REAM i REAM F/5135' TO 7700' TRIP IN 10 STDS THENWASH LAST TWO STDS TO
BOTTOM

19:00 - 06:00 1000 DRL 2 DRILLF/9416' TO 9465' WOB 8, ROT 40, PS 90, PP 1375, MM .5 SLIDE 15,
ROTATE 15', SLIDE 15' SLIDES ARE 3' PER HOUR HANGING UP SLIDING

7/13/2008 06:00 - 19:30 13.50 DRL 2 DRILLF/9465' TO 9550' WOB 6, ROT 40, PS 90, PP 1580, MM .5, SLIDE TO DROP
ANGLE STARTED AT 15' SLIDE INCREASED TO 20' PER JOINT UNABLETO
HOLD TOOL FACE

19:30 -02:00 6.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT BIT#7 TIGHT FOR THREE STANDS AT 5t00' TQ 4800' BACK REAM
02:00 -0400 2.00 OTH CHANGE MOTOR AND BIT ORIENT TOOLS
04:00 -06:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN BIT#8 LEAVE OUT DRILL COLLARS PUT AGITATOR AND SHOCK SUB

BELOW JARS
7/14/2008 06:00 -11:30 5.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN BIT#8, PICK UP 14 JTS OF DRILLPIPE

11:30 -12:00 0.50 REAM i WASH AND REAM LAST STD TO BOTTOM
12:00-12:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
12:30 -05:30 17.00 DRL 2 DRILLF/9550' TO 9923' WOB 5-10, ROT 40, PS 90, PP 1800, MM .5 1.5 DEGREE

SLIDE 20' AND ROTATE 10 TO DROP, SLIDE 15' AND ROTATE 45' TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE SUDES GOING WELL

05:30 -06:00 0.50 SUR 1 CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS
7/15/2008 06:00 -08:30 2.50 DRL 2 DRILL F/9923' TO 9955' WOB 8, ROT 50, PS 90, PP 1800, MM .5

08:30-09:00 0.50 RIG i RIGSERVICE
09:00 -05:00 20.00 DRL 2 DRILLF/9955' TO 10279' WOB 5-11, ROT 20, PS 90, PP 1900, SLIDE 15' ROTATE

15' MOST OF THE TIME
05:00-06:00 1.00 SUR 1 CONNECTIONSANDSURVEYS

7/16/2008 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 10279' TO 10344', WOB 8-12K, ROT 20, RPM 145, PS 90, PP 1900
09:00 - 09:30 0.50 RIG i RIG SERVICE
09:30 - 18:30 9.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 10344' TO 1047T, WOB 6-9K, ROT 20, RPM 145, PS 90, PP 1900
18:30 -19:00 0.50 RIG 2 CHANGE OUT GRABBER DIES
19:00 -05:00 10.00 DRL 1 DRILLFI 10477 TO 10680', WOB 6-10K, ROT 20, RPM 145 PS 90, PP 1900
05:00 -06:00 1.00 OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS

- NOTE:ROTATE 30'& SLIDE15'
7/17/2008 06:00 - 13:30 7.50 DRL 2 DRILL F/ 10680' TO 10786', WOB 6-10K, ROT 20. RPM145, PS 90, PP 1900

(SLIDE 45% & ROTATE 55%)
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
14:00 -14:30 0.50 RIG 2 TROUBLE SHOOTMWD TOOL PROBLEM
14:30 -21:30 7.00 TRP 13 TOOH W/ BIT#8 TO CHANGE OUT MWD TOOL (KNOTTY F/ 6000' TO 4800'

MAXOVERPULL 32K)
21:30 -23:00 1.50 TRP i CHANGE BIT, MUD MOTOR, MWD TOOL, ORIENT TOOL & SURFACE TEST

MUD MOTOR
23:00 -0400 5.00 TRP 13 TlH WI BIT #9 (WASH & REAM F/ 5390' TO 5400')
04:00 -04:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM F110733' TO 10786' (PRECAUTIONARY
04:30 -06:00 1.50 DRL 2 DRILLF/ 10786' TO 10806', WOB 8-13K, ROT 30, RPM 160, PS 90, PP 1900 (PDC

BIT & .56 MUDMOTOR)
7/18/2008 06:00 -07:00 1.00 SUR 1 ATTEMPT TO SURVEY, TOOL NOT READING, SURVEY @10758' = 2.1 lNC &

216 AZ
07:00 - 16:30 9.50 DRL 2 DRILLF/ 10806' TO 10928', WOB 7-13K, ROT 20, RPM 155, PS 90, PP 2000

(SLIDE 50% - ROTATE50%)
16:30-17:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
17:00 -05:00 12.00 DRL 2 DRILLFI10928' TO 11090', WOB 14-16K, ROT 20, RPM 155, PS 90, PP 2050

(ROTATE 100%) LAST SURVEY @ 11008' =
.1 INC & 38.5 AZ

05:00 -06:00 1.00 OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
7/19/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 DRL 2 DRILL Fl 11090' TO 11104', WOB 12-16K, ROT 20, PS 90, PP 1900

07:30 - 08:00 0.50 ClRC 1 PUMP DRY SLUG
08:00-14:00 6.00 TRP 10 TOOHW/BIT#9

4#4/ if g gi Printed: 1Æl2009 1:32:27
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release: 7/31/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

7/19/2008 14:00 -15:00 1.00 TRP 1 CHANGE BITS, P/U i STAND DRILL COLLARS & FUNCTION BOP
15:00 -17:00 2.00 TRP 10 TIH W/ BIT#10 TO CASING SHOE
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILLLINE
18:30 -20:00 1.50 TRP 10 TIH TO 6625' (WASH & REAM 3 STANDS 4485' TO 476T)
20:00 -21:00 1.00 CIRC 1 TIGHT @6625' CIRCULATE SWEEP
21:00 - 23:00 2.00 TRP 10 TlH TO 11020'
23:00 -23:30 0.50 REAM i WASH & REAM F/ 11020' TO 11104' (i STAND, PRECAUTIONARY) 10' FILL
23:30 -05:30 6.00 DRL 2 DRILLFI11104' TO 11215', WOB 10-14K, ROT 10, RPM 128, PS 80, PP 1620
05:30 -06:00 0.50 OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS

7/20/2008 06:00 -18:30 12.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/ 11215' TO 11303', WOB 12-19K, ROT 15, PS 90, PP 1930
(SLIDE 15'-4 HRS)

18:30 -20:00 1.50 OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS (PROBLEM W/ EM TOOL F/ SURVEYS)
20:00 - 20:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE & PUMP DRY SLUG
20:30 - 02:00 5.50 TRP 2 TOOH W/ BIT# 10
02:00 -03:00 LOO TRP 1 CHANGE BITS, MUDMOTORS & EM TOOL. ORIENT TOOL
03:00 -06:00 3.00 TRP 2 TIH W/ BIT #11 TO 6500'

7/21/2008 06:00 -09:00 3.00 TRP 2 FINISH TlH TO 11220' W/ BIT#11
09:00 -09:30 0.50 REAM i WASH & REAM F/ 11220' TO 11303' (PRECAUTIONARY)
09:30 -05:00 19.50 DRL 2 DRILLF/11303' TO 11446', WOB 12-16K, ROT 10, RPM 128, PS 80, PP 1550

(ROTATE 55% - SLIDE 45%)
05:00 -06:00 1.00 OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS

7/22/2008 06:00 -12:00 6.00 DRL 2 DRILLF/ 11446' TO 11511', WOB 12-16K, ROT 15, RPM 128, PS 80, PP 1550
(SLIDE F/ 11446' TO 11466')

12:00 -12:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:30 -04:00 15.50 DRL 2 DRILLF/11511' TO 1168t', WOB 12-16K, ROT 20, RPM 138, PS 80, PP 1640

(SLIDE F/11640' TO 11660'- 11675' TO 11681')
04:00 -06:00 2.00 OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS

- NOTE: BUILDING ANGLE @2.4 DEGREE PER ONE HUNDRED, NOTIFIED ALAN
WALKER Wl BLM BY PHONE @0800 HRS OF INTENT TO TEST BOP

7/23/2008 06:00 -06:30 0.50 DRL 2 DRILL F/ 1168f TO 11682', WOB 12-16K, PS 90, PP 1780 (SLIDING)
06:30 -07:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE, BUILD& PUMP DRY SLUG
07:30 - 14:30 7.00 TRP 2 TOOH W/ BIT # 11
14:30 - 16:00 1.50 TRP 1 LAYDOWN AGITATOR, SHOCK SUB, GAP SUB, MUD MOTOR & PONY COLLAR
16:00 -17:00 LOO OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
17:00 -23:30 6.50 BOP 2 RIG UP BC QUICK TEST & TEST BOP, UPPER & LOWER PIPE RAMS, BLIND

RAMS, CHOKE & KILLLINE, CHOKE MANIFOLD,FLOOR VALVES & DOUBLE
BALLVALVEF/ TOP DRIVE W/250 PSI LOW & 5000 PSI HIGH. TEST ANNULAR
W/ 250 PSI LOW & 2500 PSI HIGH. RIG DOWN

23:30 -00:30 1.00 OTH INSTALLWEAR BUSHING
00:30 -01:30 1.00 TRP i MAKE UP BIT,MUD MOTOR & DIRECTIONAL TOOLS, ORIENT TOOLS
01:30 -02:30 1.00 OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB
02:30 -06:00 3.50 TRP 2 TlH W/ BIT #12

7/24/2008 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 TRP 2 FINISH TIH TO 11568' W/ BIT # 12 (4350' TO 4740' - KNOTTY, WASH & REAM)
10:00 -10:30 0.50 REAM i WASH & REAM F/ 11568' TO 11682' (PRECAUTIONARY)
10:30 -17:30 7.00 DRL 2 DRILLFl11682' TO 11763', WOB 8-10K, ROT 20, RPM 155, PS 90, PP 1750

(SLIDE 40% - ROTATE 60%)
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG i RIG SERVICE
18:00 -04:00 10.00 DRL 2 DRILL F/ 11763' TO 11880', WOB 8-20K, ROT 20 RPM 145, PS 85, PP 1750 (SLIDE

25% - ROTATE 75%)
04:00 -06:00 2.00 OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS

7/25/2008 06:00 - 12:00 6.00 DRL 2 DRILL F/ 11880' TO 11956', WOB 16-21K, ROT 30, RPM 155, PS 85, PP 1780
12:00 - 12:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:30 -04:00 15.50 DRL 2 DRILL Fl 11956' TO 12151', WOB 12-20K, ROT 30, RPM 160, PS 90, PP 1830

Printed: 14/2009 1:32:27
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release: 7/31/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

7/25/2008 04:00 -06:00 2.00 OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
- NOTE: CURTIS 50' LOWER, ENTRADA 60' LOWER THAN PROG

7/26/2008 06:00 -09:30 3.50 DRL 2 DRILLFI12151' TO 1216T, WOB 16-2tK, ROT 30, RPM160, PS 90, PP 1850
(SLIDE 10'- ROTATE6')

09:30 - 10:00 0.50 CIRC 1 BUILD& PUMP DRY SLUG
10:00-16:00 6.00 TRP 2 TOOHWlBIT#12
16:00 -18:30 2.50 TRP i LAYDOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS, 2 NMDC & MUD MOTOR. P/U NMDC & .26

MUD MOTOR, M/UBIT& SURFACE TEST MUD MOTOR (HIGH WIND W/ HARD
RAIN)

18:30-01:00 6.50 TRP 2 TIHW/BIT#13
01:00 -01:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM Flit960' TO 12167 (PRECAUTIONARY)
01:30 -05:30 4.00 DRL 1 DRILLFI 12167 TO 12238'. WOB 8-12K, ROT 20, RPM 85, PS 95, PP 1700
05:30-06:00 0.50 OTH CONNECTIONS&SPR

- NOTE: TO CHANGED TO 12650'
7/27/2008 06:00 -08:30 2.50 DRL 1 DRILLFI 12238' TO 12271', WOB 10-14K, ROT 20, RPM 85, PS 95, PP 1700

08:30 -09:00 0.50 RIG 2 TROUBLE SHOOT PROBLEM W/ PASON STROKE COUNTER
09:00 - 14:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 1227t' TO 1231T, WOB 12-19K, ROT 30, RPM 95, PS 95, PP 1700
14:00 - 15:00 1.00 RIG i RIG& TOP DRIVE SERVICE
15:00 -05:30 14.50 DRL 1 ORILL FI 1231T TO 12560'. WOB 16-20K, ROT 25, RPM 90, PS 95, PP 1700
05:30 -06:00 0.50 OTH CONNECTIONS & SPR

7/28/2008 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 DRL 1 DRILL6-1/2" HOLE F/ 12560' TO 12623', WOB 20K, ROT 25, RPM 90, PS 95, PP
1700

10:30 -12:00 1.50 TRP 14 PUMP DRY SLUG & SHORT TRIP 10 STANDS
12:00 -14:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, PUMP SWEEPS
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 SUR 1 DROP SURVEY & PUMP DRY SLUG
15:00 - 21:30 6.50 TRP 2 TOOH FOR WIRE LINE LOGS (SLM -12625' NO CHANGE)
21:30 -22:00 0.50 OTH RETRIEVE SURVEY, DRAIN MOTOR & BREAK OFF BIT
22:00 -05:00 7.00 LOG 1 RIG UP HALLIBURTONLOGGERS, HELD SAFETY MEETING, RlH & LOG W/

TRIPLE COMBO & BHC SONIC. (LOGGERS DEPTH 12618'} L/D TOOLS
05:00 -06:00 000 OTH RUN #2- R/U RESISTIVITY TOOL &RIH

7/29/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 LOG 1 LOG #2 RESISTIVITY WOULD NOT PASS 4700' PULL ALLAND RIG DOWN
HALLIBURTON

07:30 -09:30 2.00 TRP 2 LAYDOWN MUD MOTOR, MONEL AND CROSS OVER, PICK UP BIT SUB AND
188 PLACED 30' ABOVE BIT

09:30 -10:00 0.50 RIG 2 RIGREPAIR,REPAIR AIR LINE ON COMPOUND CLUTCH
10:00 -10:30 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN TO SHOE
10:30 -12:30 2.00 RIG 6 SLIP AND CUT DRILLINGLINE
12:30 -13:00 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP INTO 4700' TAG
13:00 - 14:30 1.50 REAM i WORK HOLE F/4700' TO 5t00'
14:30 -20:00 5.50 TRP 2 FINISH TRIP IN
20:00 -20:30 0.50 REAM i WASH LAST TWO STDS TO BOTTOM
20:30 -23:30 3.00 CIRC 1 BRING VIS UP TO 52 AND CIRCULATE
23:30 -05:00 5.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT TO LOG
05:00 -06:00 1.00 LOG i RIG UP HALLIBURTONAND RUN #3 LOG TO RERUN RESISTIVITY

7/30/2008 06:00 -13:00 7.00 LOG i RUN TRIPLE COMBO WOULD NOT PASS 4912' COME OUT AND RUN TRIPLE
COMBO AND SONIC WOULD NOT PASS 4912' RIG DOWN LOGGERS

13:00 -18:00 5.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN TO CONDITION FOR CASING
18:00 -18:30 0.50 REAM i WASH AND REAM LAST STD TO BOTTOM
18:30 - 23:00 4.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE FOR CASING
23:00 -00:00 LOO OTH RIG UP LAYDOWN MACHINE
00:00 -06:00 6.00 TRP 3 LAY DOWN DRILL STRING

7/31/2008 06:00 - 12:30 6.50 TRP 3 LAYDOWN DRILL STRING
12:30 - 13:00 0.50 OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING

??HB Púnted: -009 1:32:27
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release: 7/31/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date 144m - To Hours Code Description of Operations

¾1/2008 13:00 -15:00 2.00 CSG 1 RIG UP CASING CREW
15:00-15:30 0.50 CSG 2 RUN41/2"CASING
15:30-16:30 1.00 OTH THREW FAN BELTS ON LAYDOWN TRUCK
16:30 - 19:30 3.00 CSG 2 RUN 4 1/2" CASING
19:30 -20:30 1.00 OTH REPLACE FAN BELTS ONF LAYDOWNTRUCK BEARING OUT OF FAN

20:30 -23:00 2.50 CSG 2 RUN 4 1/2" CASING
23:00 -00:00 1.00 OTH TONGS WOULD NOT TORQUE UP CHANGE OUT POWER TONGS

00:00 -04:30 4.50 CSG 2 RUN 4 1/2" CASING LANDEEDAT 12602' KB RAN 279 JTS OF R3, HCP-110,
#13.5 CASlNG WITH 10 MARKER JTS FLOAT SHOE AND FLOAT COLLAR ARE
STACKED

04:30-06:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE, RIG DOWN CASING CREW
8/1/2008 06:00 -11:30 5.50 CIRC i CIRCULATE CASING, RIG UP HALUBURTON AND PACK OFF WELLHEAD,

WAITON CHECK VALVEFOR NITROGEN TRUCK WAS LOST ON ROAD
COMING TO LOCATION

11:30 -14:00 2.50 CMT 2 CEMENT WITHHALLIBURTÒN,CASING LANDED g 12602' OEMENTED WITH
10 BBLS FRESH WATER,30 BBLSOF SUPERFLUSH,10 BBLS WATER, 130
BBLS OF 9.5 PPG 1.48 YIELDFOAMED LEADA CEMENT, 147 BBLS OF i tPPG
1.48 YIELD FOAMED LEAD B CEMENT, 26 BBLS OF 14.3 PPG 1.48 YIELDTAIL
CEMENT DISPLACEDWITH 188 BBLS OF CLAYFIXWATER, BUMPED PLUG
HELD PRESSURE ON PLUG FOR 15 MINUTES 50 BBLS OF CEMENT TO
SURFACE,FLOATS HELD

14:00 -18:00 4.00 LOC 4 CLEAN MUD TANKS, NIPPLE DOWN, RIG RELASE: 7/31/2008 18:00

18:00 -06:00 12.00 OTH RIG DOWN WAIT ON DAYUGHT

Printed: 1/6/2009 1:32:27
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perations Summary Report - COmþLEtt on

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

9/1612008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 "TIGHT HOLE"

On 9/15/08 MIRU Basin Well Service rig #1. NU frac head assemblywithsingle ram
BOP on top. SIFN. On 9/16/08 willstart to tallyand rabbitin the hole with bit and
scraper and new tbg...

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

9/17/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 LOC 2 "TIGHT HOLE"

On 9/16108 SICP=0#. Tally and rabbit in thehole with3-3/4" milland 4-1/2"
csg.scraper and new2-3/8" EU 8rd 4.7# P-110 tbg. to9850'. SIFN. On 9/17/08 will
continuetotallyand rabbit in the hole withnewtbg.toPBTD.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@i2600???

9/22/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 FíSH i "TIGHT HOLE"

On 9/17/08 SITP and SICP=0#. Continue to tallyand rabbit in thehole with milland
scraper and newtbg.and tag fillat 12515'. Circ.hole down to 12545' (new
PBTD-9/17/08).Circ.hole clean with2% KCLwater. POOH with milland scraper and
tbg..SI well. On 9/18 and 9/19/08 wellwill remain SI pending logging and perforating
on 9/22/08.

Casing size:4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-1tO
Casing depth: 12601' FC@i2600?77

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600??7

9/23/2008 106:00-16:00 10.00 PERF 1 "TIGHT HOLE"

On 9/22/08 SICP=0#. MIRU Cased Hole Solutions. Fillhole with 2% KCLwater.
Run a CBL/VDL/GRlog from tag at 12531' to 500' with top of cement est.at 1050'.
Correlated to Halliburton Density log dated 7/27/08 run #1. Pressure test csg with
quicktest to 6500# alongwith frac head. Pressure test to full manifoldand related
valvesto 8500#. OK. RDMO Quick test. Bled off allpressure. Perforate the following
Wingate intervals using a 2-3/4" csg.gun at 3 JPF and 120° phasing per the CBL log
dated 9/22/08: 12464-72' and 12484-92' (IFL and FFL at surface and no blow or
vacuumafterperforating). RDMO Cased Hole Solutions and SIFN. Total of 48 holes.
On 9123/08 willRIH withret.packer and tbg...

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casingdepth: 12601' FC@i26007??

Perfs:
Wingate:Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

9/24/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TIGHTHOLE"

Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

9/24/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 On 9/23/08 SICP=0#. RíH with4-1/2" ret.packer and tbg.andset packer at 12296'.
Break down Wingateperfs.at 2200#and pump 10 bbl.of 2% KCLwater at i BPM at
2400#with ISiP=2000#. Bled off tbg..RU swab. IFLat surface. Make 6 swab runs
and recovered 25bbl.of water with no gas and FFL at 4000'. RD swab and SIFN. On
9/24/08 willacidizeWingate perfs.

Casing size:4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@t2600???

Load from yesterday: 52
Minus daily recovery:25
Plus watertoday:10
LLTR: 37

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

9/25/2008 06:00 - ‡6:00 10.00 SWAB i "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingateintervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'
On 9/24/08 SITRand SICP=0# withpacker set at 12286' to test abovewingateperfs.
RU swab. IFLat 3700'. Make 1 swab and recovered 3 bbis of water with nogas.
MIRU Halliburton acid crew. acidized Wingate intervals 12464-72' & 12484-92' as
follows: Pump 2000 gal.of15% HCL acid with additiveswith75-7/8" Bio-balls
recoveredthroughouttheacid and flush with 60 bbis of 2% KCLwaterover 4.1 rpm,
Avg. at 4650#. several 10-20# breaks. ISIP=1650#. Total of 110 bbl.of load. RDMO
Halliburton. Open tbg.andflowed back 1/2 bbl of water and tbg. died. RU swab IFLat
surface. Make 1swab withand recovered58 bbl.of slight gas cut waterwith FFL at
3700'. Final PH=1. Had show of gas. LLR=52 bbl.RD swab and SIFN. On 9/25/08 will
continueto swab and/orflow.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casingdepth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 17
Minus dailyrecovery: 88
Pluswatertoday:it0
LLTR:89

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

9/26/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'
On 9/25/08 SITP=50# and SICP=0# withpacker set at 12296'. Bled off tbg.withno
fluid recovery.RU swab. 1FLat 2500'. Make 18 swab runs and recovered 85 bbl.of
med gas cut waterwitha finafPH=7 and a final fluid level at 4800' whilepulling from
6300'. RD swab and SIFN. On 9/26/08 will continue to swab.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110

Púnted: 1I8f2009 12:36:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Descriptionof Operations

9/26/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 Casing depth: 12601' FC@i2600??7

Load from yesterday:89
Minus daily recovery: 85
LLTR: 4

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

9/29/2008 06:00-16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 "TIGHTHOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'

On 9/26/08 SITP=50# and SICP=0# withpacker set. Bled off tbg.withno fluid
recovery. RUswab. IFL at 3200'. Make i swab runto 4800' and tag somethingin
tbg.and sandline spun and POOH withsandline and tools. Had to Cut off sandline and
having troublewithdrum. Roovered 4 bbl.of water and SIFW. On 9/29/08 willcheck
out drum and possiblysplace sandline and swab after takinggas analysis.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-i t0
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 4
Minus daily recovery: 4

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

9/30/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'

On 9/29/08 SITP-300#and SICP=0#with packer set. Took gas analysisfrom tbg.with
the followingresults: N2-3.3%; Methane=72.5%; CO=22.9%; BTU-758; Grav.0.7978.
Bled off tbg.withno fluid recovery. RU swab. IFL at 3400'. Make 15 swab runs and
recovered69 bl.of veryslight gas cut waterwithtracesof tarryblack hard oil. FFL at
5000' whilepulling from6200'. RD swab and SIFN. On AM of 9/30/08 SITP=100#
and SICP=0#. RU swab. IFL at 3700'. Will continue to swab on 9/30/08.

Casing size: 4-1/2"13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600??7

Load from yesterday: 0
Minus dailyrecovery: 69
LLTR: 69 over

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

Printed: t/8/2009 12:35:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date Frorn - To Hours Code Description of Operations

9/30/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1

10/1/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'

On 9/30/08 SITP=100# and SICP=0# with packer set. Bled off tbg.withno fluid
recovery. RU swab out at 3700'. Make 22 swab runs and pressured 79 bbis at very
slight gas out withFFL at 6500'with a slight traceof gas. FFL holding at 5800, 6500'.
Have a totalof 148 bbi over load. RD swab and SIFN. On 10/1/08 willrun a gas
sample and waiton orders.

Casing size:4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@i2600???

Load from yesterday: 69
Minus daily recovery:79
LLTR: 148 over

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

10/2/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92'

On 10/1/08 SITP=250# and SICP=O# withpacker set at 12306'. Took gas sample with
thefollowingresults from Wingate perfs.12404-72' and 12484-92'.N2-3.71%
Methane=77%. CO2=17.87% BTU=806.39'; Grav=0.7516. Bled off well with no fluid
recovery. RU swab IFLat 4200'. Make 10 swab runs and recovered 38 bbl.of very
slight gas cut water with FFL at 7100' while pulling from 8600' on the last 2 runs. RD
swab and SIFN. On 10/2/08 willrelease packer and POOH withpacker and tbg.and
wirelineset a CIBP and perforate additional intervals.

Casing size:4-1/2" 13.5#HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@i2600???

Load from yesterday: 148 over
Minus daily recovery: 38
LLTR: 186 over

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

10/3/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TlGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92' CIBP over Wingateat 12450'
(10/2/08). Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes).

On 10/2/08 SITP=150#from Wingate perfs. SICP=0#with packer set. RU swab. IFL

DENT Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 - Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

10/3/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 at 3800'. Make i swab run and recovered 4 bbl.of water. RD swab. Filltbg.with2%
KCL water and release packer and POOH with pakcerand tbg..MIRU Cased Hole
Solutinsand wireline set a 4-1/2" ClBP at 12450'. Perforate thefollowing Keyenta
intervals per the CBL log dated 9/22/08 using a 2-3/4"csg.gun at 3 JPF and 120°
phasing: 12312-20 & 12368-74' (42 holes). IFLand FFL at 3100'. RDMO Cased Hole
Solutins. RIHwith ret.packer and tbg.and set the packer at 12215' withthe "F" nipple
at 12183'. SIFN. On 10/2/08 willbreakdown the Keyenta perfs.with2% KCL water and
swab test thiszone.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@f2600?77

LLTR: 52

Perfs:
Wingate:Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)

10/6/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92' CISP over Wingate at 12450'
(10/2/08). Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes).

On 10/3/08 SITP and SICP=0 with packer set at 12215'. Break down Keyenta perfs.
12312-20' and 12368-74' down tbg.witha break at 1700# and pump 10 bbl.of 2% KCL
water at 1-1/2 BPM at 1700#. Bled off tbg with no fluid recovery. RU swab.1FL at
surface. Make 3 swab runs and rec.10 bbl.of water and swab meandrelcame apart
Release packerand POOH withpacker and tbg.and recovered and layed down swab
mandrel. RIHwith ret.packer and tbg.and set pakcerat 12215' with "F" nippleat
12183'. SIFN.

oN 10/4/08 SITP and SICP=0#with packer set at 12215'. RU swab.JFL at3400'.
Make 4 swab runs and swab welldownto 8200' and recovereda totalof 20 bbl.of water
witha very slight show of gas and FFL at 8200'. Make 2 additinal runs with no fluid
recovery. SIFW. On 10/6/08 willobtain gas sample and swab.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@i2600???

Load from yesterday:52
Minus daily recovery: 20
Plus watertoday:10
LLTR: 42

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
leolated with CIBP at 12450'

Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code e Description of Operations

10/6/2008 06:00-16:00 10.00 SWAB i Keyenta:t0/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)

10/7/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92' CIBP over Wingate at 12450'
(10/2/08). Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes).

On 10/6/08 GlTP=<10# and SICP=0/Awith packer setto isolate and test the Keyenta
interval. Took gas analysiswith thefollowingresults: N2=13.11;Methane=85.19'
CO2=.0214; BTU=897.3; Grav=0.6t96. Bled offtbg..RU swab. IFL at 5000'. Make7
runs withFFL at 8200' due to maxlenght of swab line and recovered7 bbl.of water
todaywith no entrythe last hour withFFL at 8200'. RD swab and SIFN. On 10/7/08
willtakeadditional gas analysis.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 42
Minus daily recovery: 7
LLTR:35

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#4: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with C18P at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' &12368-74' (42 holes)

10/8/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TlGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92' CIBP over Wingate at 12450'
(10/2/08). Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes).

On 10/7/08 SITP=10#and SICP=0#with packer set and testing the aboveKeyenta
perfs...Obtaina gas samplewiththefollowingresults: N2=6.6%; Methane=91.5%;
CO2=0.02^; BTU=962.7; Grav=0.5928. Bled offtbg.and RU sWab. IFL at 6000'.
Make i swab run. Filltbg.with2% KCLwater. Release packer and POOH with packer
and tbg..SIFN. On 1018/08 willprepare well for frac of the above Keyenta on 10/10/08.

Casing size: 41/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@i2600???

LLTR:35

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)

ÛÜNFF TM Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

ate From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

10/8/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i

10/9/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92' CIBP over Wingate at 12450'
{10/2/08). Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes).

On 10/8/08 finish NU frac head assembly...Waiting on frac on 10/10/08.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-it0
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

LLTR:35

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 1012/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)

10/13/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 "TIGHT HOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92' CIBP over Wingate at 12450'
(10/2/08). Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes).

On 10/10/08 MIRU Halliburton frac crew. Frac the following Keyenta perforated
intervals 12312-20' and 12368-74' down 4-1/2" esg.using a Puregel lil HT 2% KCL
x-linkedgel 70% CO2 foam system as follows: Pump a 6900 gal.pre-padfollowedby a
2600 gal.pad and stage 1-4 ppg 20/40 interprop in 6300 gal.of fluid and flush with 3948
gal.offluid. Had a 70 quality CO2 system witha 50% quality system in theflush with
the last 10 bbl.of flush CO2 cut. Pumped a totalof 465 bbl.of fluid and a totalof 52700
#s of sand. Used a totalof 95 tons of CO2 cut. Pumped a totalof 465 bbl.of fluid and
a totalof 52700 #s ofsand. Used a totalof 95 tons of CO2 downhole.
Max.rate=39.7; Ave=33.6BPM; Max.psi=7122#; Ave=5182#.ISIP=2952# (.68).
RDMO Halliburton. After a 1-1/2hour Si periodSICP=2000#. Open thecasing on a
28/64" choke and flowthe csg.and from 7:00PM on 10/10/08 until7:OOPMon 10/11/08
the wellflowed 540 bbl.of fluid witha final FCP=0#on a 28/64" choke with 10 bb.of
fluid recoveredthe last 9 hours each. Open thecsg.on a full 1" choke at 6:00PM on
‡0/11/08 and continueto flow the wellto thepit with0#FCP and straight CO2 gas with
no methane and no fluid and on 10/12/08 FCP =0# withstright CO2 vapors and no
methane. Will continue to flowand clean up CO2.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-i t0
Casing depth: 12601'FC@1260077?

Load from yesterday: 35
Minus daily recovery: 540
Plus watertoday:500
LLTR: 5 over.

Perfs:

Printed 118/2009 ‡2:35:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date Frorrt To Hours Code Ðescriptian ofOperations

10/13/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)

10/14/2008 06:00-16:00 10.00 PERF 2 "TIGHTHOLE"
Testing Wingate intervals 12464-72 and 12484-92' CIBP over Wingate at 12450'
(10/2/08). Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes).

On 10/13/08 wellventingCO2 vapors tothepitwith no fluid recovery in the last 24
hours on a fuli 1" choke and no FCP. On 10/14/08 willset a ClBP over the Keyenta
perfs and perforate Entrada intervals

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@i2600???

LLTR: 5 over.

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
1solated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)

10/15/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 PERF 2 "TIGHT HOLE"
CIBP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes} CIBP overthe Keyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testingthe Entrada gross perforatedinterval 11898-12050'

On AM of 10/14/08 no flow of any kind with a FCP=0# and no fluid recovery the last 24
hours. MIRU Cased Hole Solutions and ran a gauge ring to 12300'. Wireline set a
4-1/2" CIBP at 12280'. Perforate per the CBL log dated 8/22/08 the following Entrada
intervals at 3 JPF using a 2-3/4" csg.gun and 120° phasing: i t898-11904';11926-30';
i 1986-94' & 12048-50' (48 holes). No obvious fluid level before or after perforating.
No change in surface pressure. RDMO Cased Hole Solutions. RIH with ret.packer
and tbg.to3850' and SIFN. On 10/15/08 willcontinuetoRlH with packer to breakdown
and test the aboveEntrada intervals and willacidizeon 10/15/08.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@i260077?

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated with CIBP at 12450'

Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

10/15/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 PERF 2 Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
1 1986-94' & 12048-50'

10/t6/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DEQ 2 "TIGHT HOLE"
CIBP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over theKeyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testing theEntrada gross perforated interval 11898-12050'

On 10/tS/08 SITP and SICP=0#. Continue to RIH withpacker and tbg.and set packer
at 11800'. Fillceg.and testto 1000# and held OK. Load tbg.with2% KCLwaterand
breakdown Entrada gross perforated Interval 11898-12050' at 2685# and pump 10
bbl.of 2% KCL at 2 BPM at 2100# with the rigpump and ISIP=1080#. MIRU Superior
Services and acidize Entrada perforated intervals 11898-11904'; 11926-30'; 11986-94'
and 12048-50' down 2-3/8" tbg.asfollows: Pump5 bbLof 2% KCLwater followed by
2000 gal.of15% HCL with additives and 75-7/8" 1.1 SG ball sealers in theacid and
flush with 60 bbl.of 2% KCL water. Total of 120 bbl.of load + tbg.volume. Max.rate of
3.5 BPM; Max.psi of 2990#. Prior toballs on perfs.had 3 BPM at 1800#and after all
balls on perfs.had 3 BPM and 2020#. 1SIP-1120#. Total to recover of 170 bbl..SI the
well and RDMO Superior. Open the tbg.and flowed back 32 bbLTbg.died. RU swab.
IFLat 100'. Make 6 runs and recovered 71 bbl.of fluid with a final PH=0 and FFL at
4600' while pulling from 6100'. RD swab and SIFN. On AM of 10/16/08 SITP=75#
and SICP=0#. Bled offtbg.withno fluid recovery. RU swab. IFLat 3800'. Will
continue to swab today.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 1260f FC@12600???

Minus daily recovery: 71
Plus watertoday:170
LLTR: 99

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated withClBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08:
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'

10/17/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TiGHT HOLE"
CIBP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over the Keyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testingthe Entrada gross perforated interval 11898-12050'

On 10/16/08 SITP=75#and SICP=0#. Bled off tbg.withno fluid recovery. RU swab.

Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35 37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

10/17/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i lFL at 3800' Make 14 swan runs and recovered 57 bbl.of lite gas cut water withFFL
pulling from the "F" nipple at 11766' and the last 2 runs were hourly runs with 2-1/2
bbLper run. RD swab and SIFN. Gas appears to be methane. Final PH=7

On AM of 10/‡7/08 SITP=150#. Bled off tbg..RUswab and IFLat 6700'. Will continue
toswab testtoday.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@i2600??7

Load from yesterday: 99
Minus daily recovery: 57
LLTR: 42-tbg.vol.

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: ‡0/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'

10/20/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TIGHT HOLE"
CIBP overWingate at 12450'{t0/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' {42 holes) ClBP over the Keyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testing the Entrada gross perforated interval 11898-12050'

On 10/17/08 SITP=150#and SICP=0# with packer set testingentrada interval
11898-12050'. Bled off tbg.withno fluid recovery. RU swab. IFLat 6700'. Make5
runs and swabbedwelldown to"F" nippleand recovered18 bbl.of slight gas out water.
Make 2 hourly runs and recovered2 to2-1/2 bbl.per hour of slightgas cut waterwithno
afterflowfor a totalrecovery of 22 bbl..today. FFL at 10500'. RDswab and SIFW. On
10/20/08 willobtaingas analysis and swab. Final PH =7.

Casing size:41/2" 13.5# HCP-i f0
Casing depth: 12601' FC@f2600???

Load from yesterday: 42
Minus daily recovery: 22
LLTR:20

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;

NW¾lm"alTIAI
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

10/20/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i 11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'

10/21/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DEQ 2 "TIGHT HOLE"
CIBP overWingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over the Keyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testingtheEntrada gross perforated interval 11898-12050'

On AM of 10/20/08 SITP=600# and SICP=0# with packer set at 11798'. Bled well
down to550# and tooka gas sample withthe followingresults: N2-2.62; CO=7.0;
Methane=86.29%; BUT-970.4; Grav=0.669. Bled offtbg.withno fluid recovery. RU
swab. IFLat 6500'. Make 8 swab runs and swabbed welldown after recovering24
bbl.of light gas cut waterwhilepulling from the"F" nipple. Make 3 hourl runs with IFL
between 10700-1‡000' and recoveredan additional 5 bbLof water withno after flow.
Pulled from the "F" nippleat 11766'. RD swab and SIFN. Recovered a totalof 29
bbl.today. On AM of 10/21/08 SITP=200# and IFL at 6300'. Will continue to swab on
10/21/08 whilewaitingon orders.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday: 20
Minus daily recovery: 29
LLTR: 9 over

Perfs:
Wingate: 2'one#t: 9/22/08:
12464-72' &12484-92'
Isolated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' &12048-50'

10/22/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TíGHT HOLE"
CIBP overWingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over the Keyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testing the Entrada gross perforated interval 11898-12050'

Correction to 10/21/08 report: SITP=200# and SICP=0# with packer set but the IFL
was at 7900'. Make 3 swab runs and recovered 12bbl.of slightgas cut waterand
swabbed tbg.dryto "F" nippleat 11766'. Make 7 additionalhourly runs and recovered i
bbl.per hour of very slightgas cut water with noafterflow.FFL at 11400' whileputling
from "F" nippleat 11766'. RD swab and SIFN. On 10/22/08 willcontinue to swab.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-i t0
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600??7

Load from yesterday: 9
Minus daily recovery:19

2%faan"liPhi"MTi A i
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date Frern - To Hours Code Description ofOperations

10/22/2000 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i LLTR:26 over

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'

10/23/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TIGHT HOLE"
CIBP overWingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over the Keyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testing the Entrada gross perforatedinterval 11898-12050'

On 10/22/08 SITP=300# and SICP=0# withpacker set. Bled off tbg.withno fluid
recovery. RUswab. IFLat 7500'. Make 5 swab runs and swabbed tbg.dryafter
recovering 11 bbi.of slight gas cut water. Make 5 hourly runs with IFLaveraging 11400'
while pulling from the "F" nipple at 11766'. Recovered and additional 4 bbl.of water.
RD swab and SIFN. On 10/23/08 willrelease packer and POOH with packer and
tbg.and prepare to perforate additional zone on 10/24/08.
On AM of 10/23/08 SITP=300# and SICP=0# withpacker set. Bled off tbg.withno
fluid recovery. RU swab. IFLat 8600'. Preparing to release packer.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Casing depth: 12601' FC@12600???

Load from yesterday:26 over
Minus daily recovery: 9
LLTR:35 over

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/‡4/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'

10/24/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TIGHT HOLE"
CIBP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over theKeyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testing the Entrada gross perforatedinterval 11898-12050'

On 10/23/08 SITP=300#and SICP=0 withpacker set. Bled off tbg.withno fluid
recovery. RU swab. IFL at 8600'. Make i swab run and recovered 4 bbl.of water. RD
swab. Filltbg.with30 bbl.of 2% KCL water and release packer. POOH with packer

(fd NTIAI
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Questar E & P Page 13 of 26

Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

10/24/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i and tbg..SIFN. On 10/24/08 willwirelineset a CIBP overthe Entrada perfs.and
perforate Buckhorn intervals.

Load from yesterday: 35 over
Minus daily recovery: 4
LLTR:39 over

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated with ClBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'

10/2712008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i "TIGHT HOLE"
CISP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2108)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over theKeyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testingthe Entradagross perforated interval 11898-12050' CIBP over
Entrada at 11870' (10/24/08). Now test Buckhorn Intervals 11192'-96' and 11204-16'

I On 10/24/08 SICP=0#, MIRU Cased Hole Solutions and wirelineset a 4-1/2" CIBP at
11870'. Perforate the followingBuckhorn intervals per theCBL log dated 9/22/08 using
a 2-3/4" csg.gun at 3 JPF and 120° phasing: 11192-96' and 1120446' (48 holes). IFL
and FFL at 3800' and noblow at surface. RDMO Cased Hole Solutions. RIH with
ret.packer and 2-3/8" P-1t0 tbg.andset the packer at 11140'. Filland testannulus to
500#and SIFW.
On 10/27/08 willbreak down perfs.with rigpump and 2% KCLwater and swab tet the
above Buckhorn perfs...

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated withCISP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes}
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
i1986-94' & 12048-50'

10/28/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 "TIGHT HOLE"
CIBP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over theKeyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testingthe Entrada gross perforated interval 11898-12050' C1BP over
Entrada at 11870' (10/24/08). Now test Buckhorn Intervals 11192-96' and 11204-16

On 10/27/08 SITP and SICP=0#with packer set at 11140'. Filltbg.with10 bbl.of 2%
KCLwaterand breakdown Buckhorn perfs.11192-96' and 11204-16' down tbg..Break
at 2600# and pump 10 bbi.of 2% KCL at i BPM at 2350# withISIP-2200#. Open

Printed: 1/8/2009 1235:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

10/28/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i tbg.and flowed back 5 bbl.of water. RU swab. IFLat surface. Mak3 9 swab runs and
recoverd 42 bbl.of waterand swab tbg.dryto "F" nipple at 11108'. Make 3-hourly runs
and recovered an additinal1 bbl.of water fora totalrecovery of 48 bbl.ofwaterwith
it.gas. SIFN. On 10/28/08 willcontinue to swab. Load is 4 bbl.under.

Minus daily recovery: 48
Plus water today:52
LLTR: 4

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/t4/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
i1986-94' & 12048-50'

10/29/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 "TIGHT HOLE"
ClBPover Wingateat 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP overtheKeyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testingthe Entrada gross perforated interval 11898-12050' CIBP over
Entrada at 11870' (10/24/08). Now test Buckhourn INtervals 11192'-96' and 11204-16'

On 10/28/08 SITP=50#and SICP=0# with packer set at 11100'. Bled offtbg.withno
fluid recovery. RU swab. IFLat 9800'. Make 1 swab run withno recovery. MIRU
Halliburton acid crew. Acidize Buckhorn perforated intervals 11192-96' and 11204-16'
down 2-3/8" tbg.using2000 gal.of 15% HCL acid and 75-7/8" Bio-balls as follows:
Pump 5 bbl of 2% KOLwater followed by 5 bbl.of 15% acid and drop 75 Bio-balls in the
remaining acid and flush with 80 bbl.of 2% KCL water. Caught psi after pumping43
totalbbl.of fluid. Average rate was 4.6 BPM;With balls on perfs.pressure rose
graduallyfrom 4000# to 4050# withno breaks. ISIP=2800#. Si thewell and RDMO
Halliburton. Leftwell Si overnight. Total load to recover is 113 bbl.On 10/29/08 will
bleed down tbg.andswab test the Buckhom intervals.
On AM of 10/29/08 SITP=350#and SICP=0#. Bled off tbg.withno fluid recovery. RU
Swab and IFLat surface. Will swab.

Minus daily recovery: 4
Plus watertoday:113
LLTR: 117

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhom: 11192-96'; 11204-16'

Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

10/29/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i

10/30/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 "TIGHT HOLE"
CIBP overWingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over the Keyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testingthe Entrada gross perforated interval 11898.12050' CIBP over
Entrada at 11870' (†0/24/08).Now test Buckhourn1Ntervals 11192'-96' and 11204-16'

On 10/29/08 SITP=350#and SICP=0#with packer set at 11140'. Bled off tbg.withno
fluid recovery. RU swab. IFLat surface. Make 12 swab runs and recovered 72 bbl.of
med gas cutwaterand swabbed tbg.drywith a final PH=5. Make 3 hourly runs and
recovered a totalof an additional 7 bbt of gas cut waterwith IFLat approx.10300' each
timewhilepullingfrom the"F" nipple at 11108'. Total recovery todayof 79 bbLwitha
final PH=6. RD swab and SIFN. On 10/30/08 willcontinue to swab.

Load from yesterday: 117
Minus daily recovery:79
LLTR:38

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' &12484-92'
leolated withClBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 1012/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn:11192-96'; 11204-16'

10/31/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 "TIGHT HOLE" - Completion
CISP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over the Keyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testingthe Entrada gross perforatedinterval 11898-12050'
CfBP over Entrada at 11870' (†0/24/08)
Nowtest Buckhourn Intervals 11192'-96' and 11204-16'

On 10/30/08 SITP = 200# & SICP = 0# w/ pkr set. Bled off tbg w/ no fluid recovery.
RU swab. 1FL@6600'. Make 6 swab runs and recovered 22 bbls of med gas cut
waterw/ methane& acidgas & swabbed tbgdry. Make i hourly run & recoveredi bbl
of waterw/ final PH 6 5 & med gas cut of methane & acid gas. FFL@ 10300' while
pullingfrom the "F" Nipple @11108'. Release pkr @ 11140' & POOH w/ pkr & tbg.
SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will install frac head assembly & perforateadditional Buckhorn
intervals.

Load from yesterday: 38
Minus daily recovery:23
LLTR: 15 bbis

Perfs:

Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

10/31/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB i Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'

11/3/2008 06:00-16:00 10.00 PERF 2 "TIGHTHOLE"-Completion
C1BP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' &12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over the Keyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Nowtesting the Entrada gross perforated interval 11898-12050'
CIBP over Entrada at 11870' (10/24/08)
Now test Buckhourn Intervals 11192'-96' and 11204-16'

On 10/31/08 SICP=0#. Install frac head equipment. MIRU Cased Hole Solutions and
perforate the following Dakota Siltintervals per the CBL log dated 9/22/08 usinga
2-3/4" csg.gun at 3 JPF and 120° charges: 10838-40' and 10853-4T (18 holes). No
change in pressure on thewellafterperforating. Could notdetct FL but was high.
RDMO Cased Hole Solutions. Si the well for the weekend for frac scheduled on
i 1/3/08. Frac has been delayed to 11/4/08

Load from yesterday: 15
i

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30'
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'

11/4/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 "TIGHT HOLE" - Completion
CIBP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over the Keyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testingthe Entradagross perforated interval 11898-12050'
CIBP over Entrada at 11870'{t0/24/08)
Now test Buckhournintervals 11192'-96' and 11204-16'

On PM of 11/3/08 start to MIRU Halliburton frac crew. Supposed to start fracing AMof
11/4/08. LeftwellSlFN.

Load from yesterday:t5

Printed 1/8/2009 12:35:37
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-8 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASiN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date Frorn - To Hours Code Descrîption of Operations

11/4/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2
Perts:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74 (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Sin:(10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-4T

11/5/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 "TIGHT HOLE" - Completion
CISP over Wingate at 12450' (10/2/08)
Keyenta: 12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes) CIBP over theKeyenta at 12280'
(10-14-08) Now testingthe Entrada gross perforated interval 11898-12050'
CIBP over Entrada at 11870' (10/24/08)
Now test Buckhourn intervals 11192'-96' and 11204-16'

On 11/4/08 SICP=50#, MIRUHalliburton frac crew and Cased Hole Solutions. Frac
gross perforated Buckhorn and Dakota SiRinterval 10838' - 11216' down 4-1/2" csg
using a 2% KCL water slick water system as follows: Breakdown with 400 gals of 15%
HCL acid followed by a 20500 gal.pad and stage 0.50 to 1.50 ppg 30/50 resing coated
sand in 102000 gal.offluid with 7500 gal.spacers in between sand stages and flush
with 7423 gal.of stick water. Total of 3900 bbl.of waterand a totalof 99330# of sand.
Max.rate=47.1; Ave=39.8 BPM; Max.psi=7574#; Ave=4986#; ISIP=4115# (.81). This
was stage #4; Lubricate in a 4-1/2" comp.frac plug and set at 10800'. Perforate the
following Mancos intervalsper theCBL log dated 9/22/08 thefollowingintervals at 3
JPF at 120°phasing using a 2-3/4" csg.as gun: 9986'; 9974'; 9981'; 10146'; 10298';
10475'; 10489'; 10662'; 10718'.
Zone #5: (Mancos gross interval9986-10718'): Frac this interval using a 2% KCL slick
water system as follows: Breakdown with400 gal.of 15% HCL acid followed by a 10000
gal.padand stage 0.50 to 1.50 ppg 30/50 resing coated sand in 40000 gal of water with
each stage follwedby a 6000 gal.spacer and flush with6870 gal.of slick water. Total of
1990 bbl.of water and a totalof 40200# of sand. Max.rate=40.5; Ave=39.4 BPM;
Max.psi=7343#; Ave=6103#; ISIP=4346# (.86). Lubricate in a 4-1/2" comp.frac plug
and set at 9920'.
Zone #6: Perforate the following Mancos intervals per the above gun and log as follows:
9382'; 9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533'; 9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; & 9860'.
Zone #6: (Mancos gross interval 9382-9860'); Breakdown with 400 gal.of 15% HCL
acid and frac witha 10500 gal.pad and stage 0.5 to 1.5 ppg sand in 41000 gatof fluid
with 6000 gal.spacer in between sand stages and flush with6800 gal.of slick water.
Total of 36000# of sand and a totalload of 2010 bbl..Max.rate of 40.5; Ave=36.6 BPM;
Max.psi=7386#; Ave=5751#; ISIP-4005#; (.85).SIFN. On 11/5/08 willcontinuewith
additional zones.

LLTR: 7900

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9122/08:

Printed: 1/8/2000 12:35:37
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Operations Sununary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code C Descriptionof Operations

11/5/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 1246472' &12484-92'
leolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn:11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Siit: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-4T

Additional perfs:Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654';9713'; 9761'; 9860'.

11/6/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 "TIGHT HOLE"

On AM of 11/5/08 SICDP=2300#. Lubricate in a 4-1/2" comp.fracplug and set at
9330'. Perforate Zone #7 (Mancos) as follows using a 2-3/4"cag.gun at JPF and 120°

phasing per the CBL log dated 9/22/08: 8573'; 8584'; 8693'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267 & 9286' (30 holes). Frac with Hallibutton as follows:
Zone #7: {Mancos-8573-9286'}: Breakdown with 400 gal.of 15% HCL and frac witha
2% KCL slickwatersystem as follows: Pump a 10200 gaLpad and stage 0.5 to 1.5 ppg
30/50 resin coated sand in 34000 gatof fluid with 4-6000 gal.spacer stages and flush
with6000 gal.of slickwater. Total of 37500# of sand and a totalload of 2100 bbl.
Max.rate=42; Ave=39.4 BPM; Max.psi=7195#; Ave=5771#; 1SIP=3260# (.80).
Lubricate in a 4-1/2" comp.fracplug and set at 8500'. Perforate thefollowingMancos
intervat per theabove gun and log:
Zone #8: 7908'; 7913'; 7918'; 80‡4'; 8021'; 8t51'; 8212'; 8285'; 8362' & 8435' (30
holes). RDMO Cased Hole Solutions. Frac zone #8 as follows:
Zone #8: (Mancos: 7908-8435'): Breakdown with400 gal.of 15% HCL and frac with the
above system and sand as follows: Pump a 10100 gal.pad and stage 0.5 to 1.5 ppg
30/50 sand in 44500 gal.offluid with 4-6000 gal.spacer stages and flush with 5400
gal.ofslickwater. Total of 41000# of sand and a total load of 2155 bbtMax.rate=40.9;
Ave=39.8 BPM;Max.psi=6718#; Ave=5134' ISIP=3260# (.84). Si thewelland RDMO
Halliburton. After a 2-1/2 hr. period. SICP=2700#. Open the csg.on a 18/64" choke at
3:30PM on 11/5/08. Continueto flow thewellovernight and at 6:30AM on 11/6/08
FCP-2100#on a 18/64" chokewith an hourly flow rate est.at 80 bbl.per hour with light
gas and a traceof sand and a totalrecovery in the last 15 hours of 1120 bbl..Continue
toflow thewellto clean up.

Load from yesterday: 7900
Minus daily recovery: 1120
Plus watertoday:4255
LLTR: 10975

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'

ggg Printed: 1/8/2009
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/6/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 2 Isolated withCIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-4T

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; ‡0475'; 10489';
10862'; ‡0718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos;8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 926T; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos:7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 815t'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/7/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 STIM 3 "TIGHT HOLE"

On 6:30 AM on 11/6/08 FCP =2t00#on a 18/64" choke with an hourly flow rate est.at
80 bbl.per hour withlightgas and a totalrecoverysince the frac of 1120 bbl..Continue
to flow the ell during the day and evening andat 11:30PM on 11/6/08 FCP=150-200#on
2-1" chokes for the last 4 hours and flowingheavy gas at a rate of 90 bbl.per hour with
a totalrecovery of 2410 bbl..SI the well at 11:30 PM on 11/6/08 to see whatthe wellwill
build up towithpressure and attempt to bleed of gas head in AM to RlH with milland
tbg. At 7:00AM on 11/7/08 aftera 7-1/2 hours.

Load from yesterday: 10975
Minus daily recovery:1290
LLTR: 9685

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated withClBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/t4/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhom: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-4T

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974';
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/7/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 926T; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908';7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/10/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 "TIGHT HOLE"

On AMof 11/7/08 SICP =1600# aftera 7-1/2 hour SI period. Attempt tobleed offwell
on varius chokes and after3 hurs FCP=1550#on a 14/64" choke and recovered 70
bbl.of high gas cut water. Sl the wellfor 1-1/2 hours witha SICP after the 2-1/2 hours
of 2000#. MIRULone Wolf WL and wireline set a 4-1/2" comp.BP at 7800'. Bled off
casing and RDMO Lone Wolf. ND frac head assemblyand NU 10K BOP stack.
SIFN. On 11/8/08 willRIH withmilland thg.andstart todrill out composite plugs.

On 11/8/08 SICP=0#. RIH with3-3/4"milland tbg.to7790'. Load hole with 80 bbi of
2% KCLwaterand est.circ..Pressure test BOP and flow manifoldto 2000#. Drillout
compositeBP at 7800' and flowed the kick on 2-48/64" chokes with a max.psi of 750#.
Circ.hole clean with 2% KCLwater and flowthe well on a 48/64" choke at 500# and
RiH to7860' and Si pipe rams and RD swivel and nightcap tbg.whileflowing the csg.to
the pit. Start to flowthecsg.to the pit at 2:00 PM on 11/8/08 on a 48/64" chokewith
500# FCP at a rate of 50 bbl.per hourwith med.gas and no gas. Continue to flow the
wellover the weekend with the following:At 8:00AMon 11/9/08 on a 48/64" choke and
at 4:00PM on 11/9/08 FCP=550#at a rate of 5 bbi.per hourof heavy gas cut. Place on
a 18/64" chokeand at 5:00AM on 11/10/08 FCP=800#with 5 bbl,per st 15 hours of
1120 bbl..Continue toflow thewell toclean up. est totalrecoveryof 500 bbl.of water.
On 11/10/08 willattempt todrillout remaining composite frac plugs.

Load from yesterday: 9535
Minus daily recovery: 800
LLTR: 8735

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated withClBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
1 1898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Sitt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-4T

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';

I

CONR0 L Printed: 118/2009
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

11/10/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/11/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 FISH 1 "TIGHT HOLE"

On 11/10/08 FCP =800#on a 18/64" choke. Open csg. on a full 1" chokeand
FCP=200#. RIH withmiland tbg. and tagcomp. free plugat 8500' and drillout plug
with foam unit. Continue in he hole and tag comp.frac plug at 9330' and drillout frac
plug withfoam. Continue in the hole and tag and drill up composite frac plug at 9920'
Continue in the holeand tagcomposite frac plugat 10800'. Pull millto 10780' and
SIFN. Too late to drill out plug. On 11/11/08 willdrillout frac plug at 10800' and clean
out well and layd down approx.4000'of tbg..

Recovered all water pumped today.

LLTR: 8735

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated with ClBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-1 1904'; 11926-30';
i1986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10131/08)
18383-40' & 10843-4T

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 926T; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014': 8021': 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'

11/12/2008 06:00-16:00 10.00 SEQ 1 "TIGHTHOLE"

97Em?E E EN Printed: 1/8/2009
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ÖperationsSuntmary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-8 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours COde Description ofOperations

11/12/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SEQ 1 On 11/11/08 SITP =400# withfloat in bit sub assemblyand SICP=2300#. RU power
swivel and foam unitand tag comp.frac plug at 10800' and drillout frac plug, Continue
in the hole with milland tbg.and tag new PBTD at 11785'. RD foam unit. POOH and
lay down 2-3/8" P-110 tbg.to9100' and SIFN. On 11/12/08 willcontinue to POOH and
LD2-3/8" P-110 tbg.and start to RIH with new 2-3/8"L-80 tbg..

Rec.all waterused today.
LLTR: 8735

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with ClBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
DakotaSilt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-4T

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 94ß2'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267; 9286'
Zone#8:Mancos:7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285';8362';8435'

11/13/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 OTH "TIGHT HOLE"

On 11/12/08 continue to repair rig.

24 Hour Forecast: Will finish POOH & laying doen P-110 tbgand start to RIH w/ new
2-3/8" L-80 as a production string.

Rec.au water used today.
LLTR:8735

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
leolated with CISP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';

Printed: 118/2009 12:35:37
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Operations $ummary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/13/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 OTH 11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10131/08)
18383-40' & 10843-4T

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos:9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533
9608'; 9654';9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7:Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063';9184';
9246'; 9287; 9286'
Zone#8:Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021';8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/14/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 5 "TIGHT HOLE" - COMPLETiON

On 11/13/08 - SITP = 1700# & SICP = 2750#. Open up well& bled down & pump 30
bbis of 2% KCLwaterdown thetbg & POOH&lay down289 jts of P-it0 tbg. ND top
set of pipe rams. SIFN. On 11/14/08 Will RIH w/ L-80 tbg for productionstring. Had
to pump an additional 100 bble of 2% KCLwater to top kill.but well flowed back all that
was pumpedtoday.

Rec. allwater used today.
LLTR: 8735 bbis

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 13.5# RCP-i t0
Csg Depth: 12601' FC @ 12600'???

Perfs:
Wingate:Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' &1248492'
isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' &12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' &12048-50'
Buckhom: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47'

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 998t'
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';

r McinmT Al
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/14/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 5 8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8451'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

11/17/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 "TIGHT HOLE"

On 11/14/08 SfCP=1700#. Bled down to200# and pump t00 bbLof 2% KCLwater.
Tany and rabbitin the hole withnew2-3/8" EUE 8rd 4.7# L-80 production tbg.as
foKows:collar; 1 jt; 1.81" "F" nippleand 245 jts.of tbg...Land tbg.tailat 7820'. ND
BOP's and NUWH. Turn well over toproduction department. Casing was flowing the
last 2 hours of runningtbg...On 11/17/08 willRDMO Basin WS #1.
Report discontinued untilfurther activity. Alltbg.is landed high to production log.
Recovered all water pumped today.

LLTR: 8735 bbis

Tbg.Detail: collar=(O.44'); i jt.oftbg. (31.76'); "F" nipple = (.84');245 jts.of
tbg..(7765.48';);KB=22'. Tbg.tail at 7820.47; "F" nipple at 7788'. Alldepths are KB
depths.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Csg Depth: 12601' FC @ 12600'???

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated with ClBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30'
11986-94' &12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-47

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 926T; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

12/17/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 "TIGHT HOLE"
This well workwillbe to lower tbg.tofinish completion of well.

Of¾lElli MTIAI
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date Frorri - To Hours Code Description of Operations

12/17/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1
NOTE: A production log has been perforrnedon thiswellby PLS.
On 12/16/-9 MI Basin Well Service rig#3 to lower tbg.onwell. Construction workwas
being performed on battery and could not rig up. Will RU on 12/17/08 and NDWH nad
NU BOP's and prepare tostart to lower tbg..

LLTR:8735 bbis

Tbg.Detail: collar=(0.44'); 1 jtof tbg,(31.76'); "F"nipple= (.84');245 jts.of
tbg..(7765.48';);KB=22'. Tbg.tail at 7820.4T; "F" nipple at 7788'. Alldepths are KB
depths.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 13.5# HCP-1 10
Csg Depth: 12601' FC @ 12600'???

Perfs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9/22/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
isolated with CIBP at 12450'
Keyenta: 10/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
i t986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-4T

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
10146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612'; 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 9267; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918';
8014'; 8021'; 8151'; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

12/18/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 "TIGHT HOLE"
This wellwork willbe to lower tbg.tofinish completionof well.

On 12/17/08 TP and GP=25#. Bled down welland pump 15 bbl.of 2% KCLwater
down thetbg..RU Basin WS #3. NDWHand NU BOP's. Tally and rabbitin thehole
with3Tjts of 2-3/8" 4.7# EUE Brd L-80 tbg.and 22 jts.of2-3/8" 4.7# EUE Brd P-110
tbg.fora totalof 304 jts.oftbg.inthehole putting the tubingtailat 9670'. ND BOP's and
NUWH RD Basin WS. Left wellSi ovemight tobuild pressure. On 12/18/08 SITP and
SICP=1000#. Preparing to put wellon line to production department and to RDMO
Basin WS. Final report of well completion.

LLTR:
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:FR 6P-20-14-20 Spud Date: 5/3/2008
Location: 20- 14-S 20-E 8 Rig Release:
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SERVICE Rig Number: 1

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operatîons

12/18/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1
Tbg.Detail: collar=(0.44'); 1 jt.oftbg.(31.76'); "F" nipple= (.84');245 jts.of
tbg..(7765.48';);KB=22'. Tbg.tail at 7820.4T; "F" nippleat 7788'. Alldepths are KB
depths.

Csg Size: 44/2" 13.5# HCP-110
Csg Depth: 12601' FC @12600'???

Peifs:
Wingate: Zone#1: 9122/08:
12464-72' & 12484-92'
Isolated withCISP at 12450'
Keyenta: t0/2/08:
12312-20' & 12368-74' (42 holes)
Entrada: 10/14/08;
11898-11904'; 11926-30';
11986-94' & 12048-50'
Buckhorn: 11192-96'; 11204-16'
Dakota Silt: (10/31/08)
18383-40' & 10843-4T

Additional perfs: Zone #5:
Mancos: 9966'; 9974'; 9981';
t0146'; 10298'; 10475'; 10489';
10862'; 10718'
Zone #6: Mancos: 9382';
9408'; 9462'; 9488'; 9533';
9608'; 9654'; 9713'; 9761'; 9860'.
Zone:#7: Mancos; 8573'; 8584';
8593'; 8612': 8920'; 9063'; 9184';
9246'; 926T; 9286'
Zone#8: Mancos: 7908'; 7913'; 7918'
8014'; 802¾; 815f; 8212';
8285'; 8362'; 8435'.

Printed: 1/8/2009 12:35:37



Form 31 UNITED STATES |°WN
0

3D7
(August ) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Bayises;.luly 1,2010

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT di Lease Serial No.
UTU-10164

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORT WittindianAllottee or Tilsã Narne
Do not use this form for proposals to UTE TRIBE

abandoned weH. Use Form 3100-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instruct/ons onpage 2. 1 If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/ofNo
N/A

i Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other RW a No.

2. Name of Onerator 9. API Well No
QUESTAR EXPLORATION&PRODUCTION COMPANY 43-047-39809

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area cade) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
11002 EAST17500 SOUTH FLAT ROCKVERNAL, UT B4078 435-781-4331
4. Location of Well (Footage,Sec., 7tR.,M, or Survey Description) 14. Country or Parish State
2110' FNL 2059' FWL, SENW, SECTION 20. T14S, R20E UINTAH

12. CHECKTHEAPPROPREATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORTOR OTHERDATA

TYPß OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production tart/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Oxiterc. ns praeturetrat acciamation O wouintegray

SubsequentReport CasingRepair New Construction Recomplete 2 Other

O changerians Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notíce Convert to Injectíon Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or CompletedOperation: Clearly state all pettinentdetails,including estimated startingdate of any proposed work and approximate durationthereo£ If
the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recompletehorizontally,give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinentmarkers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequentreports mustbe filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form3160-4must befiledonce
testinghas been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filedonly after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determinedthat the site is ready for final inspection.)

Due to unintentional wellbore dift the new bottom hole for the FR 6P-20-14-20 is as follows.

2512' FNL 1858' FWL , SENW, SECTION 20, T14S, R20E

ECEl?E
COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

Date: î•ll dM FEB\ 0 N
initials:

DIV OF Ott, GAS &MlNING
14. I hereb cet thatthe foregoingis true and correct. Name (Nintedf/ppedf
JAN NEL

Title REGULATORYAFFAIRS

Signatu Date 02/10/2009

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Appro4ed

Cánditions of approval,if arág c 1. AppfoVaiofthisnoticedoeš not warrant or certify
that the applicant holds legal or eggi e le to thoserights in the subject lease which would flicy
entitle the ajilificaritto conduct djiaiëtf léon

Title 18 US C. Secdon 100f and Títle 43 UAC. Section 1212, make it a ciim for anÿ per onloowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of theUnited Stat s any lotse,
fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page



Ouestar Exploration and Production Company
11002 East 17600 South

GUESTÆR Vemal, UT84078

Tel435 781 4300 • Fax 435 781 4329

February 9, 2009

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 W. N. Temple STE 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

To Whom It May Concern:

In reference to the State Oil and Gas Conservation rule R649-3-3 Questar
Exploration & Production, Co. FR 6P-20-14-20 and FR 9P-17-14-20 is an
exception to this rule due to wellbore drift to a bottom hole location outside the
legal window.

Furthermore, Whiting Oil and Gas Corporation and Flat Rock Gas LLC has
consented approval for these well sites.

There are no other lease owners within 460' of the proposed location. If you have
any question please contact Jan Nelson @(435) 78 1-4331 or Chad W. Matney @
(303) 308-3048.

Thank you,

Jan Nelson
Regulatory



Independence Plate

1050 17tli Street Suite500

Denver, CO 80265

Tel 303 872 6900 * Fax 303 294 0632

Rocky IWountainRegion

July 3, 2008

Whiting Oil and Gas Corporation
1700 Broadway - Suite 2300
Denver, CO 80290
Attn: Chris Potter

Flat Rock Gas, LLC
333 West Center Street
North Salt Lake, Utah 84054
Attn: Chris Malan

RE: Agreement to Exception Locations
Oil Canyon Area
T13-14S, R20E, SLM-Multiple Sections
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions of this agreement, QuestarExplorationand Production
Company ("Questar")as operator of certain leases and lands as set out on the attached
Exhibit "A" and Whiting Oil and Gas Corporation("Whiting")as operator of lease ML-
50734, also set out on Exhibit "A", along with Flat Rock Gas LLC ("Flat Rock Gas") as a
non-operator, herewith agree to the followingprovisions regarding wellbore drift and
exception locations under the state siting rules of the State of Utah Division of Oil, Gas
and Minerals ("DOGM"). Questar,Whitingand Flat Rock Gas may be collectively
referred to below as the"Parties". A111ands and leasesfound on Exhibit "A" will be
collectively referred to below as the "Lands".

The following shall set forth the provisions of this agreement:

1. This agreement shall be effective as of April 1, 2008 and shall remain in effect as
long as any of the Lands continue to be subject to the provisions of those certain
Joint Operating Agreements, dated January 1, 2008, entered into by and between
Questar,Whiting and Flat Rock Gascoveringthe Lands.

2. Wellbore drift has been encountered in past wells drilled on the Lands. The
Parties agree to allow theoperator(s)to drill wells on the Lands without
directional drilling, thereby agreeing to allow the wellbore to potentially drift
outside of the legal window.

3. No well or wellbore will be drilled closer than 460' to any lease line without a
separate exception location, obtainedpursuantto rule R649-3-3.

4. Should a Federal unit be formed, which covers all or a portion of the lands
covered by this agreement, this agreement shall remain in effect until such time as
a board order is rendered by DOGM which vacates or suspends the state siting
rules within the unit. Those lands covered by this agreementwhich are subject



the board order shall no longer be subjectto the terms of thisagreement.With
regard to any lands covered by this agreementwhich are not includedwithin said
unit, this agreement shall remain in effect to these lands.

5. Exception locations as contemplated herein are subject to the approval of DOGM.

Sincerely,

ESTAR EXPIßRATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY

W. Matney
Associate Landman

Agreed to and accepted this3 /day of , 2008,by:

Ques xp ration and ProductionCompany

J.B. N , ExecutiveVice President

Agreed to and accepted thisLidayof 4-
, 2008,by:

Whitin ~ d ' Corporation

By: D . Seery
Title: ce President - Land

Agreed to and accepted th yo V , 2008, by:

Title: e, M /



Exhibit "A"

Attached to and made a part hereof that certain letter agreementdated July 3, 2003,
entered into by and between Questar Exploration and Production Company,Whiting

Oli and Gas Corporation and Flat Rock Gas LLC.

Lease Serial Mumber legal DescripUon Acreap

U-6610 T13S-R20E-SLM 1920.00
Section 21: All
Section 33: All
Section 34: All

U-6612 T14S-R20E-SLM 1839.89
Section 03: Lots 1-4: $2N2; S2 (AII)
Section 10: All
Section 13: NE4NE4, NE4NW4,
NE4SE4, SE48W4
Section 15: W2, NW4NE4, NW48E4

U-6632 T13S-R20E-SLM 1440.00
Section 22: W2
Section 27: W2, SE4
Section 28: AII

U-6634 T14S-R20E-SLM 2480.32
Section 01: All
Section04: Lots 1-4; S2N2, S2 (All)
Section 08: NE4
Section 09: N2, N2SE4
Section 24: All

U-10162 T148-R20E-SLM 960.38
Section 05: Lots 1-4. S2N2, S2 (All)
Section 08 82SW4,N2SE4, NW4

U-10163 T148-R20E-SLM 2120.00
Section 11: All
Section 12: All
Section 14: NE4NE4, NE4NW4,
SW4SW4, NE4SE4
Section 22: NW4NE4,W2, SE4
Section 23: SW4NE4, SW4NW4,
SW4SW4, SE4SE4

U-10164 T148-R20E-SLM 1760.00
Section 17: NW4, 82
Section 20: All
Section 21: AII

U-10165 T148-R20E-SLM 1920.00
Section 25: AU
Section 26: All
Section 27: All

U-18726 T148-R20E-SLM 40.00
Section 09: SE4SW4

U-27043 T14S-R20E-SLM - 1800.00
Section 13; W2E2, SE4NE4
W2W2, SE4NW4, NE4SW4, SE4SE4
Section 14: W2E2, SE4NE4,
NW4NW4, S2NW4, N2SW4,
SE4SW4, SE4SE4
Section 15: E2E2, SW4NE4, SW4SE4
Section 22: E2NE4, SW4NE4
Section 23; N2N2, SE4NE4, SE4NW4,
N2S2, SE4SW4. SW4SE4

ML-50734 T148-R20E-SLM 640.00
Section 16: All

Uintah County, Utah

Page 1 of



(2/9/2009) Diana Mason - 2009 Annual Waste Mgmt Plan.doc Page 1

January 13, 2009

State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re: Annual Waste Management Plan

Nacogdoches Oil & Gas operates wells, which produce certain volumes of water along
with the oil and gas. This water is from the Coconino formation. The approximate
volumes are reflected in Attachment "A". The water from the oil wells are stored in pits
& then returned to the creek bed on lease. The water from the gas wells are stored in two
400 bbl tanks & then injected down the English #7 back into our waterflood.

During typical oil field operations, small amounts of oil, less than a barrel may be spilled.
If this occurs, the contaminated soil is taken to the Montezuma Well disposal pit.

Our pumpers dispose of other incidental garbage from our operations. We assume this
waste ends up in landfills serving Montezuma County.

If you require additional information please contact me at (505) 860-2864.

Sincerely,

Angela Velasquez
Regulatory Agent
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ATTACHMENT "A"
IACOGDOCHES OIL & GAS SOUTHEAST UTAH OPERATED WELL

Monthly
Volume

Well Name No. BWPM
English 10 1,386
English 11 16
English 12 2,129
English 14 510
English 16 39
English 17 317
English 20 1,335
English 27 2,994
English 28 1,628
English 29 484
English 30 1,768
English 33 9,132
English 35



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
Ti4S, R20E, S.L.B.&M• Well locotion, FR #6P-20-14-20, locoted as shown

in the SE 1/4 NW 1/4 of Section 20. T14S. R20E,
N88°11'5]T

- 2595.32' (ye SB9'19'587 - 2628.88' (Meas) S.L.B.&M., Uintah County, Utah.
BASIS OF ELEVATION

seoring rr BENCH MARK (59 WF) LOCATED IN THE NW 1/4 OF SECTION 10,
T15S, R20E, S,L.B.&M., TAKEN FROM THE FLAT ROCK MESA
QUADRANGLE,UTAH. UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTESERIES
(TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP) PUBLISHEDBY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
ELEVATION IS MARKEDAS BEING 7449 FEET.

-- BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

FR f6P-20-14-20
2059 Elev. L/ngraded Ground = 7317

1858°
, Ð0TTOM HOLE Set Marked N

20 Stone
l ì

sectionCorner
Re-Established by
Bearing Tree
inrarmation LINE TABLE o o(ivot set on Ground) LINE BEARING LENGTH

L1 | S26°32 20"W | 456.31'

SCALE
----- tilCERTIFICATE

I LAND
THISIS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE D
FIELONOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYSM OR UNDE
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME g gg O
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BELIE

REGIST D LA DS OR
Set Marked Stone, Set Marked Set Marked REGISTR . 131
Pile of Stones nStone A =

"""" STATE kg
NB9°26'45T

- 262174' (Meas.)
NB9°J2'09T

- 261223' (Meas.) REVISED: 02-05-09

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

LEGEND: 85 SOUTH 200 FAST - VERNAL,UTAH 84078

=
90° SYMBOL

(435) 789-1017

(AUTONOMOU5) (AUTONOMOUS) SCALE OATESURVEYED: DATEDRAWN:
= PROPOSED WELL HEAD- NAp 83 (TARG¶T ßnTTOM MA¶) NAU $3 C:iUiëAtÀ.LOCAbdNi 1" =

1000° 07-23-07 07-31-07
ATITUDE = 39'35'06.9@" (39.585272) LATITUDE = 39°35'10.99" (39.586386)

= SECTION CORNERS LOCATED' LONGITUDE = 109°42'16.61" (109.704614) LONGITUDE= 109'42'13.96" (109,70387EIPARTY REFERENCES

= SECTION CORNERS (AUTONOMOUS) (AUTONOMOUS) J.W. Q.B. L-K. G.L.O. PLAT
RE-ESTABLISHED. NAD 27 (TARCET BOTTOMMOLE) NAD 27 (SURFACELOCAlluN) WEATHER FILE

LATITUDE = 39'35'07.11" (39.585308) LATITUDE = 39'35't1,12" (39.586422)(Not Set on Ground) LONGITUDE= 10942'14.12" (109.703922) LONGITUDE= 109°42'11.47" (109.703186) WARM QUESTAR EXPLR. &



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
Ti4S, R20 E, S. L.B. &M Well location, FR #6P-20-14-20, located as shown -

in the SE 1/4 NW 1/4 of Section 20, T14S, R20E,
NES'17'53T - 2595.32' (Meas.) SBOTP'58T - 2628.88' (Meas.) S.L.B.&M., Uintoh County, Utah.

s uar*,« BASIS OF ELEVATION
Beadng Tr* SENCH MARK(59 WF) LOCATEDIN THE NW 1/4 OF SECTION‡0,

T153, R20E, S.LB.&M., TAKEN FROM THE FLAT ROCK MESA
QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAHCOUNTY,7.5 MINUTESERIES
(TOPOGRAPHICALMAP) PUBLISHEDBY THE UNITEDSTATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR,GEOLOGICALSURVEY.SAID
ELEVATIONIS MARKEDAS BEING7449 FEET.

-- BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGSIS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

2059 Elev. Ungraded Ground = 7317'

Set Marked N
02 Stone

sootencomerRe-Estab//shed by
Ðearleg Tive
information

SC A LE

CERTIFICA atilliffityy
THISIS TO CERTIFY THAT THE A FROM
new NO7ES OF ACTUAL SURVE Y ME OR Y
SUPERVISION ANDTHAT THE S CO O THE
BESTOF MY KNOWLEDGEAND ,9

SURSet Marked Stone, Set Marked Set Marked GN NO. I 19s

2 '457 - 262174' (Meas.) NB9°J2'097
- 261223' (Meas.)

4485; ik
Umran ENGINEERING & I.aAND SURVEYING

LEGEND: as soUTH 200 BAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

=
90° SYMBOL (AUTONOMOUSNAD 83) (435) 789-1017

LATITUDE=
39°35'10.99° (39.586386) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATEDRAWN:

PROPOSED WELLHEAD- LONGITUDE= 109'42'13.96" (109.703878) 1" = 1000' 07-23-07 07-31-07
A = SECTlON CORNERS LOCATED. (AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES

LATlTUDE= 39'35'11.12" (39.586422) J.W. Q.B. L.K. G.L.O. PLATA = SECTION CORNERSRE-ESTABLISHEDs LONGITUDE= 109'42'11.47" (109.703186) WEATHER FILE
(Not Set on Ground) WARM QUESTAREXPLR. &



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. I FIGURE #1
,, LOCATION LAYOUT FOR
e

<>g FR #6P-20-14-20
SECTION 20, T14S, R20E, S L.B.&M.

2110' FNL 2059 FWL Approx,
la Toe of

F-6.7' $°a"dosedAccess Fill Slope (-
E/ 306 7' D. JO6 O'

SCALE: 1" = 60'
DATE: 07-31-07
DRAWN BY: L K. too' Sta. 4+00

REVISED: 02-05-09 F- 6. J
O. 307.1' Round Corners II!i

as Needed LAND

. 16131

NOTE
e Pit is to be located

a min. of 100' frorn the
Nell Head

PIRE TUSS
I I I I

PIPE RACKS
C-56'
O Jf&O'

6 c c- C-19'
a arzJ'

i so' Sta. 2+00
TOILET ;

- C-6.1' E JOS 1'
7'O Jt95°

UGHT PLANT

I sous i
PUM HOUSE

C

soos1ER

OPANE Sta 0+50
--- - STORAGE

C-1.1'
EL 114 5'

Ra 0+00
Jetm Pit

4 C-5 7'
soit stoce,

Appro R 305.6'
Top of /

NO TES. Cut Slope

Elev. Ungraded Ground At Loc Stoke = 7J/ Z J'
« - a s UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURV EYING

F/N/SHED GRADE ELEV AT LOC STAKE = i J.4 86 So 200 Fast • Vernal. Utalt 84078 * (435)



Form,3160-4
(Atgust 20CV)

UNITED STATES -

DEPARTMENT OF THEINTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires July 3L 20]o

WELL COMPLETIONOR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. LeaseSerialNo
UTU-10164

la. Type of Well DOil Well Gas Well Ury Other 6 ff Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b Type of Completion: New Mell E_|Mork Ch er Deepen Plug Back DE R UTE TRIBE

Other Unit or CA Agreement Name and No

2. Name of Operator .
,

8 Lease Name and Wel] No.Questar Exploration & Production Co. FR 6P 20 14 20
3. Address 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH - VERNAL, UT 84078 3a Phone No (mclude area codel 9 AFI Well No.

435.781.4342 - Dahn Caldwell 43-047-39809
-1. Location of M ell (Report locarronclearh and in accordance a ir/r Federal requiremenrs>* 10 Fieldand Pool or Exploratory

2110' FNL, 2059' FWL, SENW, SEC 20-T14S-R20E UNDESIGNATED
At surface ! I Sec , T , R , M., on Block and

Survey or Area SEC 20-T14s-R20E

At top prod. interval reporte lo ggi 12 Countvor Parish I3. State

At totaldepth (Bottom) 2512' FNL, 1858' FWL, SENW, 820-T14S-R20E UINTAH UT
14. Date Spudded 15 Date TD Reached 16 DateCompleted 11/15/2008 17 EleVELions (DF. RKB. RT. GL)*
05/29/2008 07/27/2008 DD & A Readyto Prod. 7,360' KB
18. TotalDepth: MD 12.623' 19. PlugBack T D.: MD 12.600' 10 Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD CIBP @ 11870', 12280', 12450'

TVD ( ggd TVD ¡ (¶93 TVD
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22 Was well cored? E N.9 O Yes (Submir analysis)

CBL & SPECTRAL DENSITY DSN ARRAY COMP TRUE RESISTIVITY wasDST run? No O Yes (Submit report)
Dires tronal Sur No O Yes 9 Subrun opo

23. Casingand Liner Record (Repvr all strm.es s¢r mm ell)

Hole Size Size Grade Wi. (#ln.} Top (MD) Bonom (MD)
Stage cementer No of SCk & Si el cementTop* Amount Pulled

15-1/2" 10-3/4" 40.5# 520' 430 SXS SURF - CIRC
9-7/8" 7-5/8" 29.7# 3812' 1,015 SXS SURF - UNK
6-1/2" 4-1/2° 13.5# 12,602' 1,125 SXS 1,050'- LOG

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Sizu Depth Set (MD} Packer Depth (MD)

2-3/8" 9671'
25. Producing Intervals p†ÿCp6 -Ogg¢ g-ppágkgy 26. PerforationRecord

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No Holes Perf Status
A) SEE ATTACHMENT ONE SEE ATTACHMENT ONE
B)
C)
D)
27. Acid.Fracture, Treatment.CemeatSqueeze.etc

Depth Inlerval Amount and Typeof Material
SEE ATTACHMENT ONE SEE ATTACHMENT ONE

28. Production - Interval A
DateFirst TestDate Hours Test 3]I Gas Water 3ilGravity 3as roductionMethod
Produced Tested Production 1181. MCF IBL orT API 3ravity FLOWING
11/15/08 12/2/08 24 12 280 80

Choke Tbg. Press Osg. 24 Hr Jil Gas Water as/Oil WelI Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rate 'IBL MCF dBL Ratic PRODUCING

? 72 739
28a. Production - IntervalB
DateFirst restDate Hours fest Jil 3as Water 3ilGravirv Jas JroductionMethod
Produced Tested Predac on BBL MCF SBL Corr API 3ravitv

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 4 Hr Jil Gas Water 3as/OG Well Status
Size F]wg. Press. Rate BBL MCF 'Bl. Ratio

Si

RE ED*(See instructionsand spaces for additional data on page 2)

JANi 3 2009

DN.0FOlL,GAS&



28b. Production - IntervalC '
DateFirst Test Date Sours fest 3il 3as Nater 3il Gravity 3as 'roduction Method
Produced Tested Production 3BL MCF 3BL Corr.API 3ravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Osg. 24Hr. Jil 3as Water 3as/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. late 3BL MCF 3BL Ratio

SI

28c. Prodt etion - IntervalD
Date First Test Date Hours fest 3il 3as Water 3il Gravity 3as 3roduction Method
Produced Tested ?roduction BBL MCF 3BL Corr. API 3ravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Osg. 24 Hr 3il 3as Water 3as/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. late 3BL MCF 3BL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Solid,used forfuel,vented, etc.)
SOLD

30. Summaryof Porous Zones (IncludeAquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Showall importantzones of porosityand contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stemtests,
includingdepth interval tested, cushion used, timetool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and
recoveries.

Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents,etc. Name

Meas. Depth

CASTLEGATE 6688'

BLACKHAWK 6939'

DAKOTA SILT 10839'

MORRISON 11230'

CURTIS 11772

ENTRADA 11889'

32. Additionalremarka (include p ugging procet ure):

FUTURE OIL PROSPECTS: GREEN RIVER

33. Indicate which itemshavebeen attached by placing a check in the appropriate boxes:

O ElectricaUMechanica1Logs (I full set req'd.) Geologic Report O DST Report Directional Survey

O Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification Core Analysis Other: PERFORATION &FRACING REPORT

34. I hereby certifythat the foregoingand attachedinformationis completeand correct as determinedfromall availablerecords(see attachedinstructions)*

Name (please int JlM SIMONTON Title COMPLETION SUPERVISOR

Signature
.

Date 01/08/2008

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to departmentor agency of the United States any
false, fic1itiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. gpg
(Continuedon page 3) 3160-4, page



FR 6P 20-14-20 - Attachment One
PERFORATION DETAIL:
Open Pgrfs Surnulation Perf Status

7908' ' Open-Mancos
7913' Open -Mancos
7918' Open-Mancos

8014' Open-Mancos
8021' Open-Mancos

8151' Frac w/ 41,000 Lbs in 90,510 Gals Open - Mancos
8212' Open-Manoms
8265' Open-Manoos
8362' Open-Mances

8435' Open - Mancos

8573' Open - Mancos
8584' Open-Manoos
8593' Open-Mancos
8612' Open-Mancos
8920' Open-Mancos
9063' Frac w/ 37,500 Lbs in 88,200 Gals Open - Mancos
9184' Open - Mancos
9246' Open-Mancos

9267' Open -Mancos
9286' Open -Mancos

9382' ' C)pen- biancos
9408' Open - Mancos
9462' Open-Mancos

9488' Open-Mano3s

9533' Open - biancos
9608' Frac w/ Š6,000 Lbs in 84,420 Gals Õpen- Ñancos
9654' Open-Mancos
9713' Open-Mana3s

9761' Open-Mancos

9860' Open -Mancos

9986' Òpen- Mancos
9979' Open -Mancos

9981' Open-Mancos
10146' Õpen-Mancos
10298' Frac w/ 40,200 Lbs in 83,580 Gals Open - Mancos
10475' Õpen- Mancos
1048 Open-Manoos
10662' ( Den - I ancos
10718' ( Jen - Mancos



10838'- 10840' Open - Dakota Silt
10843'- 10847' Frac w/ 99 00 Lbs in 163,800 Gals Open - Dakota Silt
11192' - 11196' Open - Buckhorn
11204'- 11216' Acidize w/ 2,000 Galsof 15% HCL Acid Open - Buckhorn

CIBP@11,870' CIBP@11,870'

11898' - 11904' Closed - Entrada
11926' - 11930' Closed - Entrada
11986'- ii994' Acidize w/ ,Õ0ÕGalsof i5%HCL Acid CÍosed- Entrada
12048' - 12050' Closed - Entrada

CIBP @12,280' CIBP@12,280'

12312' - 12320' Frac w/ 52,700 Lbs in 19, 530 GaIs Closed - Keyenta
i2358' i2374' Änd 95 ons o CO2cut losed yen

CIBP@12,450' CIBP @12,450'

12464' - 12472' Closed - Wingate
iï484'- 12492' Äcidkew/ Õ0 Gals of 15% HCL Ãcid losed - Wingan

CONF



CONFllEN11AL
Survey Report -

Company Questar E&P Wlag. Decl. 11.46
Well FR6p-20-14-20 Target Inc. 1.37
Field Flat Rock Target TVD

Rig Unit 236 Target Az. 205
Nevis D.D. Dan Mack I Bill Kay Tgt. Coor.

Date No. DEPTH INC. AZM C.L. T.V.D. V.S. NIS ElW DLS B.fD. Walk
14-Jul 47 9970 2.70 212.10 32 9953.38 410.70 373.16 S 171.53 W 0.73 0.31 14.38
14-Jul 48 10003 2.70 218.20 33 9966.34 412.22 374.43 8 172.43 W 0.87 18.48
14-Jul 49 10035 2,30 219.20 32 10018.31 413.58 375.52 S 173.30 W 1.26 -1.25 3.13
14.Jul 50 10067 1.60 219.40 32 10050,29 414.64 376.37 S 173,99 W 2.19 -2.19 0.63
14-Jul 51 10100 1.20 213.60 33 10083.28 415.42 377.01 S 174.47 W 1,28 -1.21 -17.58

15-Jul 52 10132 1.60 209.40 32 10115.27 416.20 377.68 S 174.88 W 1.29 1.25 -13.13

15-Jul 53 10165 2.10 206.60 33 10148.26 417.26 378.62 S 175.37 W 1.54 1.52 -8.48

15-Jul 54 10197 2.20 209.10 32 10180.23 418.46 379.68 S 175.94 W 0.43 0.31 7.81
15-Jul 55 10229 2.10 209.00 32 10212.21 419.66 380.73 8 176.52 W 0.31 -0.31 -0.31

15-Jul 56 10262 2.10 205.50 33 10245.19 420.87 381.81 S 177.07 W 0.39 -10,61

15-Jul 57 10294 2.00 201.80 32 10277.17 422.01 382.85 -S 177.53 W 0.52 -0.31 -11.56

15-Jul 58 10327 2.20 198.10 33 10310.15 423.21 383.99 S 177.94 W 0.73 0.61 -11.21

15-Jul 59 10359 2.30 194.40 32 10342.12 424.46 385.20 S 178.29 W 0.55 0.31 -11.56

15-Jul 60 10392 2.40 198.00 33 10375.09 425-79 386,49 S 178.67 W 0.54 0.30 10.91
15-Jul 61 10424 2.40 198.90 32 10407.07 427.12 387,77 S 179,09 W 0.12 2.81
15-Jul 62 10456 2.60 203.80 32 10439.04 428.52 389.06 S 179.60 W 0.91 0.63 15.31
15-Jul 63 10489 2.50 207.40 33 10472.00 429.98 390.39 S 180.24 W 0.57 -0.30 10.91
16-Jul 64 10521 2.00 204.10 32 10503.98 431.24 391.52 8 180.79 W 1.61 -1.56 -10.31

16-Jul 65 10554 1.50 195.50 33 10536.96 432.24 392.46 S 181.14 W 1.71 -1.52 -26.06

16-Jul 66 10586 1.40 194.20 32 10568.95 433.04 393.24 S 181.35 W 0.33 -0.31 -4.06

16-Jul 67 10619 1.00 183.60 33 10601.95 433.70 393.92 S 181.46 W 1.38 -1.21 -32.12

'l6-Jul 68 10651 1.30 184.90 32 10633.94 434.30 394.56 S 181.51 W 0.94 0.94 4.06
18-Jul 69 10683 1,60 185.40 32 10665.93 435.06 395.37 S 181.58 W 0.94 0.94 1.56
16-Jul 70 10716 1.70 198.30 33 10698.91 435.98 396.29 S 181.78 W 1.16 0.30 39.09
17.Jul 71 10758 2.10 218.00 42 10740.89 437.36 397.50 S 182.43 W 1.68 0.95 42.14
17-Jul 72 10781 2.50 218.10 23 10763.87 438.26 398.24 S 182.99 W 1.78 1.74 9.13
17-Jul 73 10813 2.10 224.60 32 10795.85 439,49 399.21 S 183.83 W 1.49 -1.25 20.31
17-Jul 74 10845 1.10 236.80 32 10827.83 440,31 399.79 S 184.50 W 3.28 -3.13 38,13
17.Jul 75 10878 0.40 282.10 33 10860.83 440.60 399.94 S 184.88 W 2,63 -2.12 137.27
17-Jul 76 10910 0.40 345,90 32 10892.83 440.54 399.81 S 185.01 W 1.32 199.38
17-Jul 77 10943 0.40 7.90 33 10925.83 440.34 399.58 S 185.02 W 0.46 -66.67

17-Jul 78 10975 0.10 20.00 32 10957.83 440.21 399.45 S 185.00 W 0.95 -0,94 37.81
18-Jul 79 11008 0.10 38.50 33 10990.83 440.15 399.40 S 184.97 W 0.10 56.06
184ul 80 11040 0.10 153.80 32 11022.63 440.14 399.40 S 184.94 W 0.63 360.31
18-Jul 81 11054 0.20 189.90 14 11036.83 440.17 399.44 S 184.93 W 0.77 0.71 115.00
19-Jul 82 11087 0.30 160,80 13 11049.83 440.22 399.49 S 184.93 W 0.85 0.77 83.85
19-Jul 83 11100 0.40 195.80 33 11082.83 440.41 399.69 S 184.96 W 0.41 0.30 45.45
19-Jul 84 11132 0.60 194.00 32 11114.83 440.68 399.96 S 185.03 W 0.63 0.63 -5.63

19-Jul 85 11162 0.80 192.40 30 11144.83 441.04 400.32 S 185.11 W 0.67 0.67 -5.33

19-Jul 86 11197 0.90 141.80 35 11179.82 441.40 400.77 S 185.00 W 2.09 0.29 -144.57

19-Jul 87 11230 1.20 195.90 33 11212.82 441.86 401.31 S 184.93 W 3.00 0.91 163.94
20-Jul 88 11266 1.60 203.60 36 11248.81 442.74 402.13 S 185.24 W 1.23 1.11 21.39
20-Jul 89 11299 2.30 207.50 33 11281.79 443.86 403.14 8 185.73 W 2.16 2,12 11.82
20-Jul 90 11331 1,80 210,30 32 11313.77 445.00 404.14 S 186.28 W 1.59 -1.56 8.75
20-Jul 91 11364 1.30 222.80 33 11346.75 445.87 404.86 S 186.79 W 1.82 -1.52 37.88
214ul 92 11396 1.10 223.40 32 11378.76 446.51 405.35 S 187.25 W 0.63 -0.63 1.87

Schlumberger



Ei! Survey Report -

Company Questar E&P Mag. Decl. 11.46
Well FR6p-20-14-20 Target loc. 1.37
Field Flat Rock Target TVD

Rig Unit 236 Target Az. 205
Nevis D.D. Dan Mack I Bill Kay Tgt. Coor.

Date No. DEPTH INC. AZM C.L. T.V.D. V.S. NIS ElW DLS B.lD. Walk
6-Jul 1 7980 7.20 205.75 7969.22 275.04 248.99 S 116-85 W 0.28
6-Jul 2 8254 7.60 207.20 274 8240.94 310.32 280.57 S 132.59 W 0.16 0.15 0.53
6-Jul 3 8319 6.60 205.50 65 8305.44 318.35 287.77 S 136.16 W 1.57 -1.54 -2.62

7-Jul 4 8384 5.40 207.90 65 8370.08 325.14 293,84 S 139.20 W 1.89 -1.85 3.69
7-Jul 5 8449 4.90 207.80 65 8434.82 330.97 299,00 S 141.93 W 0.77 -0.77 -0.15

7-Jul 6 8514 4.50 204,40 65 8499.60 336.29 303.78 $ 144.28 W 0.75 -0.62 -5.23

7-Jul 7 8587 4.60 205.90 73 8572,37 342.08 309.02 S 146.74 W 0.21 0.14 2.05
7-Jul 8 8620 4.40 208.90 33 8605.27 344.67 311.34 S 147.89 W 0.65 -0.61 3.03
74ul 9 8652 4.20 208.90 32 8637.18 347.07 313.48 S 148.98 W 0.62 -0.63

74ul 10 8685 3.80 206.30 33 8670.10 349.31 315.48 S 149.98 W 1.82 -1.82 -1.82

8-Jul 11 8750 1.80 203.20 65 8735.03 352.37 318.25 S 151.29 W 2.78 -2.77 -4,77

8-Jul 12 8782 2.40 204.10 32 8767.01 353.54 319.33 S 151.76 W 1.88 1.88 2.81
8-Jul 13 8879 4.70 198.80 97 8863.81 359.53 324.94 S 153.87 W 2.39 2.37 -5.46

8-Jul 14 8911 5.20 198.20 32 8895.69 362.27 327.56 S 154.75 W 1.57 1.56 -1.88

8-Jul 15 8944 4.60 198.80 33 8928.57 365.07 330.23 S 155.64 W 1.82 -1.82 1.82
94ul 16 8976 3.90 201.10 32 8960.48 367,43 332.46 5 156.44 W 2.25 -2.19 7.19
94ul 17 9009 3.30 203.20 33 8993.42 369.50 334.38 S 157.22 W 1.86 -1.82 6.36
94ul 18 9041 2.60 208.20 32 9025.38 371.15 335.87 S 157.93 W 2.33 -2.19 15.63
9-Jul 19 9073 2.20 209.90 32 9057.35 372.48 337.04 S 158.58 W i.27 -1.25 5.31
9dul 20 9106 1.70 223,30 33 9090.33 373.58 337.95 S 159.23 W 2.04 -1.52 40.61
9-Jul 21 9138 1.50 232.30 32 9122.32 374.40 338.55 S 159.89 W 1,00 -0.63 28.13
9-Jul 22 9170 1.80 234.30 32 9154.30 375.21 339.10 S 160.63 W 0.95 0.94 6.25
104ul 23 9203 1.90 221.10 33 9187.29 376.19 339.81 S 161.41 W 1.32 0.30 -40.00

10-Jul 24 9235 1.80 208.40 32 9219.27 377.20 340.66 S 161.99 W 1.32 -0.31 -39.69

10Aul 25 9268 1.90 199.30 33 9252.25 378.26 341.63 S 162.42 W 0.94 0.30 -27.58

10-Jul 26 9300 1.60 192.30 32 9284.24 379.23 342.56 S 162.69 W 1.15 -0.94 -21.88

10-Jul 27 9333 1.80 196.40 33 9317.22 380.19 343.51 S 162.94 W 0.71 0.61 12.42
10-Jul 28 9365 2.40 194.00 32 9349.20 381.34 344.64 S 163.24 W 1.89 1.88 -7.50

12-Jul 29 9399 3.10 192.20 34 9383.16 382.94 346.23 S 163.61 W 2.07 2.06 -5,29

12dul 30 9432 3.70 185,20 33 9416.10 384.81 348.17 8 163.89 W 2.21 1.82 -21.21

12-Jul 31 9464 4,10 181.80 32 9448.03 386.83 350.34 S 164.02 W 1.44 1.25 -10.62

12-Jul 32 9497 4.00 176.80 33 9480.95 388.93 352.67 S 163.99 W 1.11 -0.30 -15.15

13-Jul 33 9516 4.10 176.30 19 9499.90 390.11 354.01 8 163.91 W 0.56 0.53 -2.63

13-Jul 34 9548 3.80 170.9D 32 9531.82 391.99 356.19 S 163.67 W 1.49 -0.94 -16.88

13-Jul 35 9580 3,40 180.00 32 9563.76 393.73 358.19 S 163.50 W 2.18 -1.25 28.44
13-Jul 36 9613 2.90 195.60 33 9596.71 395.44 359.97 S 163.73 W 2.99 -1.52 47.27
13-Jul 37 9645 2.40 210.40 32 9628.68 396.91 361.33 S 164.29 W 2.64 -1.56 46,25
13-Jul 38 9678 2.20 217.30 33 9661.65 398.21 382.43 S 165.02 W 1.03 .0.81 20.91
13-Jul 39 9710 2.20 214.30 32 9693.63 399.42 363.43 S 165.74 W 0.36 -9.38

14-Jul 40 9743 2.60 216.00 33 9726.60 400.78 364.56 S 166.53 W 1.23 1.21 5.15
14-Jul 41 9775 2.40 216.60 32 9758.57 402.15 365.68 8 167.36 W 0.63 -0,63 1.87
14-Jul 42 9808 2,80 213.50 33 9791.53 403.62 366.91 S 168.22 W 1.28 1.21 -9.39

144ul 43 9840 2.60 208.80 32 9823.50 405.12 368.19 S 169.00 W 0.93 -0.62 -14.69

144ul 44 9873 2.30 205.10 33 9856.47 406.53 369.45 S 169.64 W 1.03 -0.91 -11.21

14-Jul 45 9905 2.30 204.50 32 9888.44 407.81 370.62 S 170.18 W 0.08 -1.87

14-Jul 46 9938 2.60 207.50 33 9921.41 409.22 371.88 S 170.80 W 0.99 0.91 9.09

Schlumberger



Survey Report

Company Questar E&P Mag. Decl. 11.46
Well FR6p-20-14-20 Target Inc. 1.37
Field Flat Rock Target TVD

Rig Unit 236 Target Az. 205
Nevis D.D. Dan Mack I Bill Kay Tgt. Coor.

Date No. DEPTH INC. AZM C.L. T.V.D. V.S. N/S EIW DLS B.lD. Walk
21-Jul 93 11429 0.60 252.00 33 11411.74 446.93 405.84 S 187.63 W 1.94 -1.52 88.67
21.Jul 94 11461 0.70 321.60 32 11443.74 446.96 405.54 S 187.91 W 2.33 0.31 217.50
21-Jul 95 11493 0.50 323.90 32 11475.74 446.80 405.27 S 188.12 W 0.63 -0.63 7.19
21-Jul 96 11526 0.60 274.60 33 11508,74 446.79 405.14 S 188.37 W 1.42 0.30 -149.39

21-Jul 97 11558 0.90 228.80 32 11540.74 447.08 405.29 S 188.73 W 2.02 0.94 -143.13

21-Jul 98 11591 1.70 205.50 33 11573.73 447.81 405.90 S 189.14 W 2.86 2.42 -70.61

224ul 99 11623 2.50 200.00 32 11605.71 448.98 406.99 S 189.58 W 2.58 2.50 -17,19

23-Jul 100 11654 2.50 197.90 31 11636.68 450.32 408.27 S 190.02 W 0.30 -6.77

23dul 104 11686 1.70 198.50 32 11668.66 451.49 409.38 S 190.38 W 2.50 -2.50 1.87
23-Jul 102 11719 0.60 220.90 33 11701.65 452.14 409.98 S 190.65 W 3.54 -3.33 67.88
23dul 103 11751 0.90 207.70 32 11733.65 452.55 410.33 S 190.88 W 1.08 0.94 -41.25

24-Jul 104 11783 1.10 221.00 32 11765.64 453.10 410.78 S 191.20 W 0.95 0.63 41.56
24-Jul 105 11816 0.40 273.50 33 11798.64 453.44 411.01 S 191.52 W 2.77 -2.12 159.09
24-Jul 106 11846 0.20 335.70 32 11830.64 453.45 410.95 S 191.65 W 1.11 -0.63 194.38
24-Jul 107 11881 0.30 310.90 33 11863.64 453.39 410.85 8 191,74 W 0.44 0.30 -75.15

24-Jul 108 11913 0.40 327.10 32 11895.64 453.30 410.70 S 191.87 W 0.44 0.31 50.63
24401 109 11945 0.50 327.90 32 11927.64 453.17 410.48 S 192.00 W 0.31 0.31 2.50
24-Jul 110 11978 0.50 307.90 33 11960.63 453.06 410,27 S 192.19 W 0.53 -60.61

24-Jul 111 12010 0.50 350.10 32 11992.63 452.91 410.05 S 192.33 W 1.12 131.88
24-Jul 112 12043 0.90 351.00 33 12025.63 452.58 409.65 S 192.39 W 1.21 1.21 2.73
25-Jul 113 12075 0.90 347.30 32 12057.63 452.17 409.18 S 192.48 W 0.18 -11.58

25-Jul 114 12107 1.10 347.60 32 12089.62 451.73 408.61 S 192.61 W 0.63 0.63 0.94
25-Jul 115 12123 1.10 353.30 16 12105.62 451.48 408.31 S 192.66 W 0.68 35.62
25-Jul 116 12167 0.50 353.30 44 12149.61 450.95 407.70 S 192.73 W 1.36 -1.36

25-Jul R ruey (1 131 ir p ojectod to I it

Schlurnberger



Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 2007) OMB No. 1004-0137
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR x u 3 2010

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT . ri o.
- 0

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
. nd i a

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned welt Use Form 3160-3 (APD) forsuch proposals. UTE TRIBE

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well
N/A

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No6P-20-14-20

2. Name of Overator 9. API Well No.
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. CONTACT: Mike Stahl 43-047-39809

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UTAH 84078

(303) 308-3613 UNDESIGNATED

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M, or Survey Description) 11. Country or Parish, State

2110' FNL 2059' FWL, SENW, SECTION 20, T14S, R20E UINTAH, UTAH

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

SubsequentReport CasingRepair New Construction Recomplete Other COMMINGLING

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof. If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

In Compliance with the Administrative Utah code for drillling and operating practice R649-3-22, completion into two or more pools. Questar Exploration &
Production Company hereby requests the commingling of production between intervals in the FR 6P-20-14-20. Questar considers this commingling to be in
the public interest in that it promotes maximum ultimate economic recevery, prevents waste, provides for orderly and efficient production of oiland gas and
presents no detrimental effects from commingling the gas streams.

Questar requests approval for the commingling of production of the Mancos, Dakota & Entrada intervals. Based upon offset production logs, the proposed
initial allocation is as follows: Mancos - 80%; Dakota - 10%; Entrada - 10%.

On an annual basis the gas will be sampled and a determination will be made of the BTU content and gas constituents. These
annual samples can be used to determine if the gas allocation is changing over time. Ifthese samples do not indicate that any
adjustments in allocation are necessary they may be discontinues after the fifth anniversary of the initial production.

COPYSENTTOOPEAATOR

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct Name (Printed/Typed)

Laura Bills Title Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst

Signature Date 02/18/2009

Approvedby

PACEFORFEDERALTORS OFFICEUSE

Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certi* alOfThisthat the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would Office FederalApprov
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon AnnOMS 088$80/

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to or agency of the United States any false,
fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2) FEBi 9 2009
DIVOFOIL,GAS&



AFFIDAVIT OF NOTICE

STATE OF COLORADO )
) ss:

COUNTY OF DENVER )

Chad W. Matney, being duly sworn, deposesand says:

1. That I am employed by QuestarExploration and Production Company in the
capacity as a Landman. My business address is:

Independence Plaza
1050 17thStreet, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265

2. In my capacity as a Landman, pursuant to the provisions of Utah
Administrative Rule 649-3-22, I have provided a copy of QuestarExploration
and Production Company's application for completion of the FR 6P-20-14-20
well into two or more pools, in the form of Utah Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining's Form 9 Sundry Notice, to owners of all contiguous oil andgas leases
or drilling units overlying the pools which are the subject of that application.

3. In my capacity as a Landman, I am authorized to provide such notice of
QuestarExploration and Production Company's application to contiguous
owners and to make this affidaviton this 4th day of December 2008.

Printed Name: Chad W. Matney

i I&The foregoing instrument was sworn to and subscribed before me this N day of
e lo<< 2008, by Chad W. Matney.

Notary Public THERESACHATMAN
-NOTARYPUBLIC-

Igyes « , gpggg. / j STATEOF
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Oueater Exploration and Production Cornpany
Independence Plaza
1050 17th Street, Suite 600
Denver, CO 80265
Tel 303 672 6900 • Fax 303 294 9032

Rooky Mountain Region

December 4, 2008

SEE ATTACHED MAILING LIST

Dear Owner:

Attached for your information is a copy of Questar'sapplication to the State of Utah
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining for commingling of the FR 6P-20-14-20 Well located in
Uintah County, Utah.

V u o

Chad W. Matney
Landman



MAILING LIST
FR 6P-20-14-20

NOTICE OF COMMINGLING

Flat Rock Gas, LLC
333 WestCenter Street
North Salt Lake, UT 84054
Attn: ChrisMalan

WhitingOil & Gas Corp.
1700 Broadway Suite 2300
Denver, CO



State of Utah OPERATOR ACOT No. N-5085
Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: Questar Exploration & Production Co.

ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South
IENTITYACTION FORM - FORM S Vernal, Utah 84078 (435)781-4342

Äption Òurrent New Gntity API Number Weil Name ÖQ SC TP RG Oounty 30ud Qate Effectíúe Dale
Coda Entity No.

No.
E iß925 $6925 43-047-39809 FR ßP 20 14 20 SENW 20 14S 20E Uintah 5Ï$9/2048 11/f6IOS

W$LL 1 COMMENT$: IlllNCG;DKTA; BUKHN

/ELL2 C0MMENTS:

WELL 3 COMMENTS

WELL 4 COMMENTS.

WELL 5 COMMENTS:

ACTlÓÑOODES (See instructionson back of form)
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only)
6 - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well)
C - Re-assign weR from one existing entity to another existing entíty Signature
D - Re-assign weifrom one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (eXÞlaìtiin comments section) RECEIVED °"i

Administrator 3/7/09
ete

ROTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected
MAR1 1 2009 PÑoneNo. j435Ï781-4342

(3469)

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUSSEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/20104a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Enerav FORMA.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

See attached
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See attached
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° See attacheddrillhorizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL
8. WELLNAMEand NUMBEIROIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER
See attached

2 NAMEOF o XR Of

tiOn and Production Company $$ $ Att che
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver

, CO z, 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See attached couuTY: Attached
QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE
SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This namechange involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The sameemployees willcontinue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. AIIoperations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965868683
Fee Land Bond Number:
BIA Bond Number: 799446- 9/p O/O(o JS
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As ofJune 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described onthe list

d n Regulato0ryAffairs Analyst

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED APPROVED /g
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side) . .

DIV,OFOIL,GAS&MINING Dmslon of011,GasandMinin
EarleneRussell.Ennineerina



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

WEST RIVER BEND 3-12-10-15 12 100S 150E 4301331888 14542 Federal OW P CWEST RIVER BEND 16-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332057 14543 FederaÍOW PWEST DESERT SPRING l l-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301332088 14545 Federal OW SGD 8G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333821 Federal OW APD CGD 9G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333822 Federal OW APD CGD 10G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333823 Federal OW APD CGD llG-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333824 Federal OW APD CGD 12G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333825 Federal OW APD CGD 13G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333826 Federal OW APD CGD lG-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333827 16920 Federal OW PGD 2G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333828 Federal OW APD CGD 7G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333829 Federal OW APD CGD 7G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333830 Federal OW APD CGD 14G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333831 Federal OW APD CGD 15G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333832 Federal OW APD CGD 16G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333833 16921 Federal OW PGD 1G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333834 Federal OW APD CGD 2G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333835 Federal OW APD CGD 3G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333836 Federal OW APD CGD 4G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333837 Federal OW APD CGD 5G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333838 Federal OW APD CGD 6G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333839 Federal OW APD CGD 8G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333840 Federal OW APD CGD 9G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333841 Federal OW APD CGD 10G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333842 Federal OW APD CGD 15G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333843 Federal OW APD CGD 16G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333844 Federal OW APD CGOVT 18-2 18 230S 170E 4301930679 2575 ed ÖÑFEDERAL 2-29-7-22 29 070S 220E 4304715423 5266 Federal GW TAUTAH FED D-1 14 070S 240E 4304715936 10699 Federal GW SUTAH FED D-2 25 070S 240E 4304715937 9295 Federal GW SPRINCE 1 10 070S 240E 4304716199 7035 Federal GW PUTAH FED D-4 14 070S 240E 4304731215 9297 Federal GW SISLAND UNIT 16 11 100S 180E 4304731505 1061 Federal OW SEAST COYOTE FED 14-4-8-25 04 080S 250E 4304732493 11630 Federal OW PPRINCE 4 03 070S 240E 4304732677 7035 Federal OW PGH 21 WG 21 080S 210E 4304732692 11819 Federal GW POU SG 6-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304732746 11944 Federal GW SFLU KNOLLS FED 23-3 03 100S 180E 4304732754 12003 Federal OW PGH 22 WG 22 080S 210E 4304732818 12336 Federal GÑOU GB 12W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304733249 13488 Federal GW POU GB 15-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733364 12690 Federal GW POU GB 3W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304733513 12950 Federal GW PÖÜÜB 7 i-D ÒÌ)iii0E 4304733514 12873 Federal GW PWV 9W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733515 13395 Federal GW POU GB 9W-18-8-22 18 Ã80f220E Ì304733 liššŸ Vedil äW3OU GB 3W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304733526 13514 Federal GW POU GB 12W-30-8-22 3i 080S 220E 4304733670 13380_ Federal GW PWV 10W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733814 13450 Federal GW PGH 7W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733845 13050 Federal GW PGH 9W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733846 13074 Federal GW P
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

GH 11W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733847 13049 Federal GW P
GH 15W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733848 13051 Federal GW P
WV 2W-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733905 13676 Federal GW P
WV 7W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733907 13230 Federal GW P
WV 9W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733909 13160 Federal GW P
GH 14W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304733915 13073 Federal GW P
OU GB 4W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733945 13372 Federal GW POÚÐ 9W-19-8-22 19 [080S 3i0È Ã30Ì71Ì94Ì 5593 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733947 13389 Federal GW P
OU GB 12W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304733948 13388 Federal GW P
GB 9W-25-8-21 25 080S 210E 4304733960 13390 Federal GW P
SU lW-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733985 15569 Federal IGW P
SU 3W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733987 13321 Federal OW S
SU 7W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733988 13235 Federal GW P
SU 9W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733990 13238 Federal GW P
SU 13W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 14304733994 13236 Federal GW TA
SU 15W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733996 13240 Federal GW P
WV 8W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734005 13320 Federal GW P
WV 14W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734007 13322 Federal GW S
OU GB 6W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734018 13518 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734025 13502 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734039 13413 Federal GW P
OU GB 4W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734043 13520 Federal GW P
GH 5W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734147 13387 Federal GW P
GH 6W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734148 13371 Federal GW P
GH 8W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734149 13293 Federal GW P
GH 10W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734151 13328 Federal GW P
GH 10W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734152 Ï3378 Federal GW P
GH 12W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734153 13294 Federal GW P
GH 14W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734154 13292 Federal GW P
GHiÃW-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734157 13329 Federal GW P
WV 2W-3-8-21 03 080S 210E 4304734207 13677 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734209 13414 Federal GW P
WV 6W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734272 13379 Federal GW P
GH 1W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734327 13451 Federal GW P
GH 2W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734328 13527 Federal GW P
GH 3W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734329 13728 Federal GW P
GH 7W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734332 13537 Federal GW P
GH 9W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734333 13411 Federal GW P
GH 11W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734334 13410 Federal GW P
GH 15W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734335 13407 Federal GW P
GH 16W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734336 13501 Federal GW P
WV 12W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734343 13430 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734348 13495 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734349 13507 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734350 13526 Federal GW P
SU PURDY 14M-30-7-22 30 070S 220E 4304734384 13750 Federal GW S
WVX 11G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734388 13422 Federal OW P
WVX 13G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734389 13738 Federal OW P
WVX 15G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734390 13459 Federal OW P
SU BRENNAN W 15W-18-7-22 18 070S 220E 4304734403 13442 Federal GW TA
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

SU 16W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734446 13654 Federal GW P
SU 2W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734455 13700 Federal GW P
SU 10W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734456 13540 Federal GW P
WV 16W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734470 13508 Federal GW P
OU GB 16WX-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734506 13431 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734512 13469 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734513 B461

Federal¯ÙW
P

OU GB SW-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734514 13460 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734515 13462 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734516 13489 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734517 13467 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734522 13476 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734528 13487 Federal GW S
OU GB 3W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734529 13493 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734530 13519 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734531 13494 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734532 13483 Federal GW P
OU GB 9W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734533 13500 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734534 13475 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734535 13479 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734536 13478 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734537 13484 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734538 13482 Federal GW P
OU GB 12W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734542 13543 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734543 13536 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734544 13547 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734545 13535 Federal GW P
OU GB 3W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734546 13509 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734547 13506 Federal GW P
OU GB 4W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734548 13534 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734549 13505 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734550 13550 Federal GW _P
OU GB 11W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734553 13671 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734554 13528 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734559 13539 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734560 13599 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734563 13559 Federal GW P
OU GB 1W-29-8-22 29 080SE220E 4304734573 13562 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734574 13564 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734575 13609 Federal GW S
OU GB 9W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734576 13551 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734577 13594 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734578 13569 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734599 13664 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734600 13691 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734601 13632 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734602 13639 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734603 13610 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734604 13612 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734623 13701 Federal GW P
OU GB 9W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734624 13663 Federal GW P
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

OU GB 10W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734625 13684 Federal GW P
OU GB 9W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734630 13637 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734631 13682 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734632 13613 Federal GW P
OU WIH 15MU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734634 13991 Federal GW P
OU WIH 13W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734646 13745 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734648 13822 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-9-8-22 09 080S 220E 430473468 13706 Federal GW P
OU WIH 14W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734664 13720 Federal GW P
OU GB 12WX-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734668 13555 Federal GW P
OU WIH 10W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734681 13662 Federal GW P
OU GB 4G-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734685 13772 Federal OW P
OU GB 3W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734686 13746 Federal GW P
OU GB 16SG-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734688 13593 Federal GW P
OU WIH 7W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734689 13716 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734690 13770 Federal GW P
WIH 1MU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734693 14001 Federal GW P
OU GB 5G-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734695 13786 Federal OW P
OU GB 7W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734705 13710 Federal GW P
OU SG 14W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734710 13821 Federal GW P
OU SG 15W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734711 13790 Federal GW P
OU SG 16W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734712 13820 Federal GW P
OU SG 4W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734713 13775 Federal GW P
OU SG 12W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734714 13838 Federal GW P
OU GB 5MU-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734715 13900 Federal GW P
OU SG 8W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734717 13819 Federal GW P
OU SG 9W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734718 13773 Federal GW P
OU SG 10W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734719 13722 Federal GW P
OU SG 2MU-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734721 13887 Federal GW P
OU SG 7W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734722 13920 Federal GW P
OU GB 14SG-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734743 14034 Federal GW P
OU GB 16SG-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734744 13771 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734754 13774 Federal GW P
OU GB 6MU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734755 14012 Federal GW P
OU SG 10W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734764 13751 Federal GW P
OU GB 14M-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734768 13849 Federal GW P
OU SG 9W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734783 13725 Federal GW P
OU SG 16W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734784 13781 Federal GW P
SU BW 6M-7-7-22 07 070S 220E 4304734837 13966 Federal GW P
GB 3M-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734900 14614 Federal GW P
WVX 11D-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734902 14632 Federal GW P
GB 11M-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734952 13809 Federal GW P
GB 9D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734956 14633 Federal GW P
GB 1D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734957 14634 Federal GW P
WRU EIH 2M-35-8-22 35 080S 220E 4304735052 13931 Federal GW P
GH 12MU-20-8-21

_

20 080S 210E 4304735069
_

14129 Federal GW fOU SG 4W-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735071 14814 Federal GW OPS C
OU SG 5W-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735072 14815 Federal GW OPS C
SG 6ML-11-8-22 11 080BOE 4304735073 14825 Federal GW P
OU SG 5MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735076 13989 Federal GW P
OU SG 6MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735077 14128 Federal GW P
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name sec twp rng api
,

entity mineral type stat C
lease

SG 12MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735078 13921 Federal GW P
OU SG 13MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735079 13990 Federal GW P
OU SG 9MU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735091 13967 Federal GW P
SG 11SG-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735099 13901 Federal GW TA
OU SG 14W-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735114 14797 Federal GW OPS C
SG 5MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735115 14368 Federal GW P
SG 6MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735116 14231 Federal GW P
SG 14MU-23-8-22 23 |080S 220E 4304735117 14069 Federal GW P
SG 12MU-23-8-22 . 23 080S 220E 4304735188 14412 Federal GW P
SG 13MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735190 14103 Federal GW P
WH 7G-10-7-24 10 070S 240E 4304735241 14002 Federal GW S
GB 4D-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304735246 14645 Federal GW P
GB 7M-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304735247 14432 Federal GW P
GB 14M-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304735248 13992 Federal GW P
SG llMU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735257 13973 Federal GW P
SG 15MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735328 14338 Federal GW P
EIHX 14MU-25-8-22 _ 25 080S 220E 4304735330 14501 Federal GW P
EIHX 11MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735331 14470 Federal GW P
NBE 12ML-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304735333 14260 Federal GW P
NBE 13ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735334 14000 Federal GW P
NBE 4ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735335 14215 Federal GW P
SG 7MU-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735374 14635 Federal GW S
SG lMU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735375 14279 Federal GW P
OU SG 13W-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735377 14796 Federal GW OPS C
SG 3MU-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 94304735379 14978 Federal GW P
SG 8MU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735380 14616 Federal GW P
SG 2MU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735381 14636 Federal GW P
SG 10MU-1µ8-22

_ _ 11 080S 220EL4304735382 _ 14979 Federal GW P
SU 11MU-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304735412 14143 Federal GW P
OU GB 8MU-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304735422 15321 Federal GW OPS C
EIHX 2MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735427 14666 Federal GW P
EIHX 1MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735428 14705 Federal GW P
EIHX 7MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735429 14682 Federal GW P
EIHX 8MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735430 14706 Federal GW P
EIHX 9MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735433 14558 Federal GW P
EIHX 16MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735434 14502 Federal GW P
EIHX 15MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735435 14571 Federal GW P
EIHX 10MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735436 14537 Federal GW P
GB 3MU-3-8-22 03 080S 220E 4304735457 14575 Federal GW P
NBE 15M-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735463 14423 Federal GW P
NBE 7ML-17-9-23 _ 17 090S 230E 4304735464 14232 Federal GW P
NBE 3ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735465 14276 Federal GW P
NBE 11M-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735466 14431 Federal GW P
NBE 10ML-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304735650 14377 Federal GW P
NBE 6ML-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304735651 14422 Federal GW P
NBE 12ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735652 14278 Federal GW P
ÑBE 6ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735664 14378 Federal GW P
NBE 11ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735665 14340 Federal GW P
NBE 15ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735666 14326 Federal GW P
SG 4MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735758 14380 Federal GW P
SG 11MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735829 14486 Federal GW P
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well name sec twp \ Yng api entity mineral type stat C
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PJ3 I)S FEE) 03-7-10-18 07 100S 180E 4304735932 14457 Federal (39V S
RB DS FED 14G-8-10-18 08 100S 180E 4304735933 14433 Federal OW P
OU SG 14MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735950 14479 Federal GW PÈÒŸ2MEÑ-8-i4 2 050S34NÈ̂Ï0iŠ605 74¾ Fediai OW P
WIH lAMU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304736060 14980 Federal GW P
SU 8M-12-7-21 12 070S 210E 4304736096 16610 Federal GW OPS CFIBE4hdL-10 9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736098 15732 Federal 939V P
14EGE8AILe10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736099 15733 Federal (39V P
14EMB16A4L-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736100 14728 Federal (ITV S
SUBW 14M-7-7-22 07 070S 220E 4304736136 15734 Federal GW P
14BE8AILel2-9-23 12 090S 230E 4304736143 15859 Federal GNV S5516D-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304736260 14981 Federal GMÏP14BE5AIL-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736353 15227 Feder<d (IMT P
14EGE7hfL,10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736355 15850 Federal (IVV P
14EME3A4L-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736356 15393 Federal (39V P
EIHX 4MU-36-8-22 36 080S 220Ë4304736444 14875 Federal GW P
EI_HX3MU-36-8-22 36 080S BE 4304736445 14860 Federal GW P
EIHX 2MU-36-8-22 36 080S 220E 4304736446 14840 Federal GW S
EIFTKINfD-36-8-22 36 080S 220E 4304736447 14861 Federal 39V P
14BJE7hfL-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736587 16008 Federal (19V P
14BE 8hfL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736588 15689 Federal (39V P
FIBE lhdL-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736589 15880 Federal (FYV P14BE2AIL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736590 15898 Federal (39V S
NBE 3ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736591 15906 Federal GW P
14EGE5hdL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736592 15839 Federal (39V P
14E0E9hdi,10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736593 15438 Federal (19V P
14EMSllAILe10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736594 15228 Federal (39V P
IREGE15AdL,10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736595 15439 Federal (ITV P
FIBE2AIL,17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736614 15126 Federal (39V P14BGE4NIL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736615 15177 Federal (JyV P
14BGE6NIL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736616 15127 Federal (39V S
14EGE10AIL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736617 15128 Federal (19V P
14BE 14AdL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736618 15088 Federal (39V P
14E0E9AIL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736619 15322 Federal (19V P
NBE 10D-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736620 15975 Federal GW S
NBE 12ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736621 4T Federal GW P
NBE 13ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736622 15690 Federal GW P
FIBE 14NIL-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736623 15262 Federal (39V P
NBE 16ML-26-9-2 26 090S 230E 4304736624 15735 Federal_ GW P
WF lP-1-15-19 06 150S 200E 4304736781 14862 Indian GW P
SG 3NTU-23-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304736940 15100 Federal GNV P
NBE 5ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736941 15101 Federal GW P
TU 14-9-7-22 070S RE 4304737345 16811 Federal GW OPS C14C-29-15-19 29 150S 190E 4304737541 15178 Indian GW PFIBE2AIL-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304737619 15860 Federal GNV P
GB 16AIL-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304737664 15948 Federal GVV P

ML-5-8-22_ 05 080S 220E_/304738140 Federal GW APD C
WVX 6ML-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304738141 Federal GW ,APD CWVX 1MU-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304738156 Federal GW APD C
GH 8-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304738157 Federal GW APD CWVX 4MU-17À-21 17 080S 210E 4304738190 Federal GW APD C
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
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WVX 16MU-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738191 Federal GW APD C
GH 7D-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304738267 16922 Federal GW P
WF 8C-15-15-19 15 150S 190E 4304738405 17142 Indian GW OPS C
WVX 1MU-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738659 Federal GW APD C
WVX 9MU-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738660 Federal GW APD C
GB 12SG-29-8-22 | 29 080S 220E 4304738766 16096 Federal GW S
GB 10SG-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304738767 16143 Federal GW S
FR 14P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739168 16179 Federal GW P
SU 11M-8-7-22 08 070S 220E 4304739175 Federal GW APD C
HB 2M-9-7-22 09 070S 220E 4304739176 Federal GW APD C
SUMA 4M-20-7-22 20 070S 220E 4304739177 Federal GW APD C
SU 16M-31-7-22 31 070S 220E 4304739178 Federal GW APD C
FR 13P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739226 16719 Federal GW P
SG 11BML-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304739230 ederal GW APD
SG 12DML-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304739231 Federal GW APD C
GB ICML-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304739232 Federal GW APD C
NBE 8CD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739341 16513 Federal GW P
NBE 15AD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739342 Federal GW APD C
NBE 6DD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739343 Federal GW APD C
NBE 6AD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739344 Federal GW APD C
NBE 6BD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739345 Federal GW APD C
NBE 5DD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739346 16574 Federal GW
NBE 7BD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739347 Federal GW APD C
NBE 4DD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739348 16743 Federal GW P
NBE 10CD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739349 16616 Federal GW P
NBE llCD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739350 Federal GW APD C
NBE 8BD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739351 16617 Federal GW P
NBE 3DD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739352 Federal GW APD C
NBE 3CD-26-9-23 26 090S 230Ï4304739353 Federal GW APD C
NBE 7DD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739354 Federal GW APD C
NBE 12AD-26-9-23 _ 26 090S 230E 4304739355 Federal GW APD C
NBE 5DD-26-9-23 _ 26 090S 230E 4304739356 Federal GW APD C
NBE 13AD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739357 Federal GW APD C
NBE 14AD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739358 Federal GW APD C
NBE 9CD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739359 Federal GW APD C
FR 9P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739461 17025 Federal GW S
FR 13P-11-14-20 17 140S 200E)4304739462 Federal GW APD C
FR 9P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739463 16829 Federal GW P
FR 10P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739465 Federal GW APD C
FR 5P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739509 Federal GW APD C
FR 15P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739510 Federal GW APD C
FR llP-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739587 Federal GW APD
FR 5P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739588 Federal GW [APD C
FR 9P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739589 Federal GW APD CFR 13P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739590 Federal GW APD C
GB 7D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304739661 Federal GW APD C
GB 15D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304739662 16830 Federal GW P
WV 13D-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304739663 16813 Federal GW P
WV 15D-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304739664 16924 Federal GW P
FR 14P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739807 Federal GW APD C
FR 12P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739808 Federal GW APD C
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FR 6P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739809 16925 Federal GW P
FR 3P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739810 Federal GW APD C
FR 4P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739811 16771 Federal GW P
FR 8P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739812 Federal GW APD C
FR 15P-21-14-20 21 | 140S 200E 4304739815 Federal GW APD C
FR 2P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304740053 Federal GW APD
FR 2P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304740200 Federal GW APD C
WV 11-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304740303 Federal GW APD C
GB 12-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304740304 Federal GW APD C
GH 11C-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304740352 Federal GW APD C
GH 15A-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304740353 Federal GW APD C
GH 10BD-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304740354 Federal GW APD C
FR 11P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304740366 Federal GW APD C
MELANGE Ul 09 140S 200E 4304740399 Federal GW APD C
OP 16G-12-7-20 12 070S 200E 4304740481 17527 Federal OW DRL C
OP 4G-12-7-20 12 070S 200E 4304740482 Federal OW APD C
WF 8D-21-15-19 21 150S 190E 4304740489 Indian GW APD C
WF 15-21-15-19 21 150S 190E 4304740490 Indian GW APD
WF 4D-22-15-19 22 150S 190E 4304740491 Indian (GW \APD |C
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' a United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PRIDE'+4

CH 35/ Utah State Office INAM ERICA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL 2 8 2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

1FrieldhOfficePriaceFie ce Moa Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Eastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS
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