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Energy

September 1, 2006

Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office
170 S. 500 E.
Vernal, UT 84078

Attn: Minerals Depaitment

Re: All Wells
Uintah and Duchesne Counties, Utah

Ladies and Gentlemen:

This letter is to inform you that Permitco, Inc. and Shon McKinnon are authorized to act
as Agent and to sign or retrieve documents on behalf of Gasco Production Company, a
wholly owned subsidiary of Gasco Energy, Inc. when necessary for filing county, state
and federalpermits including Onshore OrderNo. 1, Right of Way applications, etc., for
the above mentioned wells.

It should be understood that Permitco, Inc. and Shon McKinnon are acting as Agent only
in those matter stated above and are not responsible for drilling, completion, production
or compliance with regulations.

Gasco Production Company agrees to accept full responsibility for operations conducted
in order to drill, complete and produce the above mentioned wells.

Mark A. Erickson
President and CEO

GASCOEnergy, Inc.
8 inverness Drive East, Suite 100 Tel: (303) 483-0044 Email: invest@gascoenergy.com

Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: (303) 483-0011 Website: www.gascoenergy.com AMEX:

GASC0
Energy

September 1, 2006

Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office
170 S. 500 E.
Vernal, UT 84078

Attn: Minerals Depaitment

Re: All Wells
Uintah and Duchesne Counties, Utah

Ladies and Gentlemen:

This letter is to inform you that Permitco, Inc. and Shon McKinnon are authorized to act
as Agent and to sign or retrieve documents on behalf of Gasco Production Company, a
wholly owned subsidiary of Gasco Energy, Inc. when necessary for filing county, state
and federalpermits including Onshore OrderNo. 1, Right of Way applications, etc., for
the above mentioned wells.

It should be understood that Permitco, Inc. and Shon McKinnon are acting as Agent only
in those matter stated above and are not responsible for drilling, completion, production
or compliance with regulations.

Gasco Production Company agrees to accept full responsibility for operations conducted
in order to drill, complete and produce the above mentioned wells.

Mark A. Erickson
President and CEO

GASCOEnergy, Inc.
8 inverness Drive East, Suite 100 Tel: (303) 483-0044 Email: invest@gascoenergy.com

Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: (303) 483-0011 Website: www.gascoenergy.com AMEX:



PERilITC0

14421 County Rd. 10 • Ft Lupton, Colorado 80621 • (303) 857-9999 • FAX(303) 857-0577 • E-MAIL Permitco 1@aol com

October22, 2007

Divisionof011,Gas&Mining
1594West NorthTemple,Suite1210
Box145801
SaltLakeCity,UT 84114-5801
Attn:Minerals

Re: GascoProdúctionCompany
SheepWashFedera1#31-25-9-18
853' FNLand2132'FEL
NWNESection25,T95-Ri8E
UIntahCounty,Utah

Gentlemen:

EnclosedpleasefindonecopyoftheAppilcationforPermittoDdil,alongwithonecopyoftheOnshore
OrderNo.fwhichwasfiledwiththeBLMinVernal,Utah.

Ifyoushouldneedadditionalinformation,pleasedon'thesitate tocontactme. Approvedcopiesofthe
A.P.D.shouldbe sent toPermitcoInc.atthe addressshownabove.

Sincerely,

P NC.

Venessa Langmacher
C dar

du tionCompany

Enc.

cc: GascoProductionCompany- Englewood,CO g 04-9
ShawnElworthy- Roosevelt, UT
ShonMcKinnon- Altamont,
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT
(highlight changes)

5. MINERAL LEASE NO.: 6. SURFACE:

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL UTU-009803 BLM
1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILL REENTER O DEEPEN O 7 1F INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

N/A
B. TYPE OF WELL: OILO GAS© OTHER SINGLEZONE|¯\

MULTIPLEZONE 6 UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

NIA
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9 WELL NAME and NUMBER:

GascoProductionCompany SheepWash Federal#31-25-9-18
1 ADDR

in 8 Dr East, Suite100,Englewood,CO80112
PHO3NOE BE-

044
1 D AND POOL, OR W DCM:

4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTRIQTR, SECTI N, TOWNSHIP, RANGEg°i Í Ÿ0.0 04 79/ - gg gg gt / MERIDIAN:

AT SURFACE: § 09 53' FNLand2132' FEL Sec.25,T9S-R18E

AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: NWNE

14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

Approximately23.96milessoutheastofMyton UT Uintah | Utah
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16 NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

Approx.853' 1400.01 40 Acres; NWNE
16. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING,COMPLETED, OR 19 PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIEDFOR)ON THISLEASE(FEET):

Approx.1100' 12,975' Bond#UT-1233
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22 APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:

4906' GL ASAP 35 Days

24. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASINGSIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT

17-1/2" 13-3/8",H40,48# 200' 200sx PremiumType 5, 15.6ppg,1.18yield
12-1/4" 8-5/8",J-55, 32# 3,518' 588sx Hi-Lift,11ppg,3.91yield&185sx 10-2RFC,14.2ppg,1.63yield
7-7/8" 4-1/2",P110,13.5# 12,975' 366sx Hi-Lift,11.5ppg,3.05yield&1326sx 50-50Poz, 14.1ppg,1.28yield

25 ATTACHMENTS
VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PROGRAM

EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

AGENT: PermitCoInc. AGENT'S PHONE NO.: 303-857-9999

(ThN

Ro

SSEat VonOSSB 8 DTITE

Approvedby the ggy
API NUMBER ASSIGNED: APPlíO AL Utah Divisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining giv.0F0\\.,GAS&WNING

(11/2001) (See instructions o Side)
ObderaApprmet of
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RR GASCO PRODUCTIONCOMPANYT9S, RiBE, S.L.B.&M. ya ye Well location, SHEEP WASH FEDERALNB9'42'48"W - 2641.24' (Meas.) NB9°46'40"W
- 2640.66' (Meas.)

E E #31-25-9-18, located os shown in the NW 1/41910 Brass Cop, 1910 Brass Cop, &ass Cep, * ' NE 1/4 of Section 25, T9S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.,
,s,",,, "s',',, arew stones rs'n , en' Uintoh County, Utah.Post e

SHEEP MSH EEDERÆ "
BASIS OF ELEVATION

SPOT ELEVATIONLOCATED AT THE NORTHWESTCORNER OFElev. Ungraded Ground = 4906' 2132' SECTION 31, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE MOON
BOTTOM, QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE
QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHEDBY THE UNITED
STATESDEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR,GEOLOGICALSURVEY
SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKEDAS BEING 4838 FEET.

1910 Brass coP
1910 mass cap1 N stesi
0.6' Hþh, PH' N2 5 °"'°"

o - oo o o

SCALE

CERTIFICA 44

THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE ABOg M
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS OR UN
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAM E
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND B

1910 Brass Cap, Set Marked Stone, Brass ¢op, S D SUR OR0.6' Hg PQe 1.5' High, Plle of 2.J' HIgh, P//e REor stmN
9°41'21"W

- 2642.95' (Meas.) S89°39'49"E
- 2641.94' (Meas.

BASIS OF BEARINGS Unrra ENGINEERING & Lao SURVEYING
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. 85 SOUTH 200 FAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

(435) 789-1017
LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUSNAD 83) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:LATITUDE= 40'00'24.52" (40.006811) 1" = 1000' 03-22-07 03-23-07=

90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109°50'24.68" (109.840189) PARTY REFERENCES(AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) .W B.P L.K G.L.O. PLAT= PROPOSED WELLHEAD· LATITUDE= 40'00'24.65" (40.006847) WEATHER FILEA = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE= 109°50'22.16" (109.839489)
COOL GASCO PRODUCTION
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GascoProductionCompany
SheepWashFederal#31-25-9-18

853'FNLand2132'FEL
NWNESection25, T9S- R18E

UintahCounty,UT

CERTlFICATION

IherebycertifythatI,orsomeoneundermydirectsupervision,have inspectedthedrillsiteandaccessrouteproposedherein;thatIamfamiliarwiththeconditionswhichcurrentlyexist;thatIhavefullknowledge,ofstateandFederallawsapplicabletothisoperation;thatthestatementsmadeinthisAPDpackageare,tothebest ofmyknowledge,trueandcorrect;andthattheworkassociatedwiththeoperationsproposedhereinwillbe performedinconformitywiththisAPDpackageandthetermsandconditionsunderwhichitis approved.IalsocertifythatI,orthecompanyIrepresent,amresponsiblefortheoperationsconductedunderthisapplication.Thesestatementsaresubjecttotheprovisionsof18U.S.C.1001forthefilingoffalsestatements.Executedthis12*dayofJuly,2007.

Venessa Langmacher

AgentforGascoProductionCompany
Title

14421CountyRoad10,FortLupton,CO80621
Address

303/857-9999
Telephone

LSPermitco@aol.com
E-mail

RECEIVED 4

0CT3 1 2007
PERIITC0DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
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APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILt'ORREENTER

24. Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Anached.

2. A Drilling Plan
Attached.

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the SUPO shall be filed with the Appropriate Forest
Service Office.

SeeSurfaceUse Plan Attached.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see Item 20).

Bond coverageforthiswellis provided byGascoProductionCompanyundertheirBLMBondNo.Bond#UT-1233.

5. Operator certification.
Please be advisedthat GascoProduction Companyis consideredto be the operatorofthe abovementionedwell.
GascoProduction Company agreesto be responsibleunderthe termsandconditionsofthe lease for the operations
conductedupon the leased lands.

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the authorized
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ONSHOREORDERNO.1 ÔÔNFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GascoProductionCompany
SheepWash Federal #31-25-9-18 Lease No.UTU-009803
853'FNLand2132'FEL
NWNESection25,T9S-R18E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 1

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1
ApprovalofOperationson Onshore

Federaland IndianOiland GasLeases

Allleaseand/orunitoperationswillbeconductedinsucha mannerthatfullcomplianceismadewithapplicable
laws,regulations(43CFR3100),OnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,andtheapprovedplanofoperations.The
operatorisfullyresponsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe furnished
thefieldrepresentativetoinsurecompliance.

1. ESTlMATEDTOPSOFIMPORTANTGEOLOGICMARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea

Wasatch 5,405' -490'

Mesaverde 9,235' -4,320'

Castlegate 11,755' -6,840'

Blackhawk 12,010' -7,095'

SpringCanyon 12,675' -7,760'

T.D. 12,975' -8,060'

2. ESTIMATEDDEPTHOFANTICIPATEDWATER,OIL,GASORMINERALFORMATIONS:

Substance Formation Depth

Gas Wasatch 5,600'-9,235'

Gas Mesaverde 9,235'-11,755'

Gas Blackhawk 12,010'-12,875'

Allfreshwaterprospectivelyvaluablemineralsencounteredduringdrilling,willbe recorded
by depth and adequatelyprotected.Alloiland gas showswillbe testedto determine
commercialpotential.

PER
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ONSHOREORDERNO.1 CTÍNFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GascoProductionCompany
Sheep Wash Federal#31-25-9-18 Lease No.UTU-009803
853'FNLand2132'FEL
NWNESection25,T9S-R18E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 2

3. PRESSURECONTROLEQUIPMENT

GascoProductionCompany'sminimumspecificationsforpressurecontrolequipmentareas follows:

RamType: 11"Hydraulicdoublewithannular,5000psiw.p.

Ramtypepreventersandassociatedequipmentshallbe testedtoapprovedstackworkingpressure
if isolatedby testplugor to 70 percent of internalyieldpressure ofcasing. Pressure shallbe
maintainedforat least 10minutesoruntilrequirementsoftestaremet,whicheveris longer. Ifa test
plugis utilized,nobleed-offpressureisacceptable.Fora testnotutilizinga testplug,ifa declinein
pressureofmorethan10 percentin30 minutesoccurs,thetestshallbe consideredtohavefailed.
Valveoncásinghead belowtestplugshallbe openduringtestofBOPstack.

Annulartypepreventers(ifused)shallbe testedto50 percentofratedworkingpressure.Pressure
shallbe maintainedat least 10minutesoruntilprovisionsoftestaremet,whicheveris longer.

Asa minimum,theabovetestshallbe performed:

a. when initiallyinstalled;
b. wheneveranysealsubjecttotestpressureisbroken
c. followingrelatedrepairs;and
d. at 30-dayintervals

Valvesshallbe testedfromworkingpressuresideduringBOPEtestswithalldownstreamvalves
open.

Whentestingthekilllinevalve(s)thecheckvalveshallbe heldopenortheballremoved.

Annularpreventersshallbe functionallyoperatedat leastweekly.

Pipeandblindramsshallbe activatedeachtrip,however,thisfunctionneed notbe performedmore
thanoncea day.

ABOPEpitleveldrillshallbe conductedweeklyforeachdrillingcrew.

Pressuretestsshallapplytoallrelatedwellcontrolequipment.

Alloftheabovedescribedtestsand/ordrillsshallbe recordedinthedrillinglog.

PElt
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BOPsystemsshallbe consistentwithAPIRP53. Pressuretestswillbe conductedbeforedrillingout
fromundercasingstringswhichhave been setandcementedinplace. Blowoutpreventercontrols
willbe installedpriortodrillingthesurfacecasingplugandwillremaininuse untilthewelliscompleted
orabandoned.Preventerswillbe inspectedandoperatedat leastdailytoensuregoodmechanical
workingorder,andthisinspectionwillbe recordedonthe dailydrillingreport.Preventerswillbe
pressuretestedbeforedrillingcasingcementplugs.

TheDistrictOfficeshouldbenotified,withsufficientleadtime,inordertohavetheBLMrepresentative
onlocationduringpressuretesting.

a. ThesizeandratingoftheBOPstackisshownontheattacheddiagram.Althougha righas
notbeenchosentodrillthiswell,mostoftheeqúlpmentforthisdepthofholeintheareause
a 11",5000psiworkingpressureblowoutpreventor.

b. Achokelineanda killlineare to be properlyinstalled.The killlineis .not tobe used as a
fill-upline.

c. Theaccumulatorsystemshallhavea pressurecapacitytoprovideforrepeatedoperationof
hydraulicpreventers.

d. Drillstringsafetyvalve(s),tofit_all toolsinthedrillstring,aretobe maintainedontherigfloor
whiledrillingoperationsare inprogress.

4. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM:

a. The proposedcasingandcementingprogramshallbe conductedas approvedtoprotect
and/orisolateallusablewaterzones, potentiallyproductivezones,lostcirculationzones,
abnormallypressuredzones,and anyprospectivelyvaluabledepositsofminerals.Any
isolatingmediumotherthancementshallreceiveapprovalpriortouse. The casingsetting
depthshallbe calculatedtopositionthecasingseatoppositea competentformationwhich
willcontainthe maximumpressureto which it willbe exposedduringnormaldrilling
operations.Determinationofcasingsettingdepth shallbe based on allrelevantfactors,
including;presencelabsence of hydrocarbons;fracture gradients;usablewaterzones;
formationpressures;lostcirculationzones;otherminerals;orotherunusualcharacteristics.
Allindicationsofusablewatershallbe reported.
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b. Casingdesignshallassumeformationpressure gradientsof0.44 to 0.50 psiperfoot for
exploratorywells(lackingbetterdata).

c. Casingdesignshallassume fracturegradientsfrom0.70to1.00 psiperfootforexploratory
wells(lackingbetterdata)

d. Casingcollarsshallhavea minimumclearanceof0.422inchesofallsidesinthehole/casing
annulus,withrecognitionthatvariancescanbe grantedforjustifiedexceptions.

e. Allwaitingoncementtimesshallbe adequatetoachievea minimumof500psicompressive
strengthat thecasingshoepriortodrillingout.

f. AIIcasingexcepttheconductorcasing,shallbe neworreconditionedandtestedusedcasing
thatmeetsorexceedsAPIstandardsfornewcasing.

g. Thesurfacecasingshallbe cementedbacktosurfaceeitherduringtheprimarycementjob
orbyremedialcementing.

h. Allindicationsofusablewatershallbe reportedtotheauthorizedofficerpriortorunningthe
nextstringofcasingorbeforepluggingordersarerequested,whicheveroccursfirst.

i. Threecentralizerswillbe runonthebottomthreejointsofsurfacecasingwitha minimumof
onecentralizerperjointstartingwiththeshoejoint.

j. Topplugsshallbe usedtoreducecontaminationofcementbydisplacementfluid.Abottom
plugor otheracceptabletechnique,suchas a suitablepreflushfluid,innerstringcement
method,etc.shallbe utilizedtohelpisolatethecementfromcontaminationbythemudfluid
beingdisplacedaheadofthecementslurry.

k. Allcasingstringsbelowtheconductorshallbe pressuretestedto0.22psiperfootofcasing
stringlengthor1500psi,whicheverisgreater,but nottoexceed70percentoftheminimum
internalyield.Ifpressuredeclinesmorethan10percentin30minutes,correctiveactionshall
be taken.

I. Onallexploratorywells,andonthatportionofanywellapprovedfora 5MBOPEsystemor
greater,a pressureintegritytestofeachcasingshoeshallbe performed.Formationat the
shoeshallbe testedto a minimumofthe mudweightequivalentanticipatedto controlthe
formationpressuretothenextcasingdepthorat totaldepthofthewell. Thistestshallbe
performedbeforedrillingmorethan20feet ofnewhole.
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m. The proposedcasingprogramwillbe as follows:

Purpose Depth HoleSize 0.D. Weight Grade Type New/Used

Conductor 0-200' 17-1/2" 13-3/8" 48# H-40 - - - New

Surface 0-3,518' 12-1/4" 8-5/8" 32# J-55 ST&C New

Production 0-12,975' 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 LT&C New

n. Casingdesignsubjecttorevisionbased ongeologicconditionsencountered.

o. Thecementprogramwillbe as follows:

Conductor TypeandAmount

Conductor 200 sx PremiumType5 @15.6ppg, 1.18cuft/skyield

Surface TypeandAmount

TOC@Surface Lead:588sxHi-Lift@11ppg,3.91cuft/skyield
Tail:185sx10-2RFC@14.2ppg, 1.63cuft/skyield

Production TypeandAmount

TOC@2,500' Lead:366sxHi-Lift@11.5ppg,3.05cuft/skyield
Tail:1326sx50:50Poz @14.1ppg,1.28cuft/skyield

p. Anticipatedcementtopswillbe reportedas todepth;nottheexpectednumberofsacksof
cementtobe used. The DistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientleadtime,inorder
tohavea BLMrepresentativeon locationwhilerunningallcasingstringsandcementing.

q. Aftercementingbutbeforecommencinganytest,thecasingstringshallstandcementeduntil
thecementhas reacheda compressivestrengthofat least500psiat theshoe. WOCtime
shallbe recordedinthedriller'slog.

r. Thefollowingreportsshallbe filedwiththeDistrictManagerwithin30 daysaftertheworkis
completed.
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1. Progress reports,Form3160-5(formerly9-331)"SundryNoticesand Reportson
Wells",mustincludecompleteinformationconcerning:

a. Settingofeachstringofcasing,showingthesize,grade,weightofcasing
set, holesize,settingdepth,amountsand typeofcementused, whether
cementcirculatedor thetopof thecementbehindthecasing,depth of
cementingtoolsused, casingtestmethodandresults,and thedate work
was done. Showthespuddate onthefirstreportssubmitted.

b. Temperatureorbondlogsmustbesubmittedforeachwellwherethecasing
cementwas notcirculatedtothesurface.

s. Auxiliaryequipmenttobe used isas follows:

1. Kellycock
2. Nobitfloatisdeemednecessary.
3. Asubwitha fullopeningvalve.

5. MUDPROGRAM

a. The proposedcirculatingmediumstobe employedindrillingareas follows:

Interval MudType MudWf. Visc. FIL PH

O'- 200' FreshWater 8.33 1 - - - 7

200' - 3,518' FreshWater 8.33 1 - - - 7-8

3,518' - TD FreshWater&DAP 9.0-11.5 30-40 12-20 8

Therewillbe sufficientmudonlocationtocontrola blowoutshouldoneoccur.
Amudtestshallbe performedevery24 hoursaftermuddinguptodetermine,as applicable:
density,viscosity,gelstrength,staticfiltrationloss,andPh.

b. Mudmonitoringequipmenttobe usedis as follows:

1. Periodiccheckswillbe madeeachtourofthe mudsystem.The mud levelwillbe
checkedvisually.
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c. Nochromateadditiveswillbe usedinthemudsystemonFederaland/orIndianlandswithout
priorBLMapprovaltoensureadequateprotectionoffreshwateraquifers.

d. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitleIllinanamountequaltoorgreaterthan
10,000poundswillbe used, produced, stored,transported,or disposed of annuallyin
associationwiththedrillingofthiswell. Furthermore,noextremelyhazardoussubstances,
as definedin40 CFR355, inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used, produced,stored,
transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

e. The useofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformto43 CFR3610.2-3.

6. EVALUATIONPROGRAM

Theanticipatedtypeandamountoftesting,loggingand coringareas follows:

a. Nodrillstemtestsareanticipated,however,ifDST'sarerun,thefollowingrequirementswill
beadheredto:

Initialopeningofdrillstemtesttoolsshallbe restrictedtodaylighthours unlessspecific
approvaltostartduringotherhoursisobtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.However,DST's
maybeallowedtocontinueatnightifthetestwas initiatedduringdaylighthoursandtherate
offlowis stabilizedand ifadequatelightingis available(i.e.lightingwhichis adequatefor
visibilityandvapor-proofforsafeoperations).Packerscan be released,buttrippingshallnot
beginbeforedaylight,unlesspriorapprovalis obtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.Closed
chamberDSTsmaybe accomplisheddayornight.

ADSTthatflowstothesurfacewithevidenceofhydrocarbonsshallbe eitherreversedout
ofthetestingstringundercontrolledsurfaceconditions.Thiswouldinvolveprovidedsome
meansforreversecirculation.

Separationequipmentrequiredfortheanticipatedrecoveryshallbe properlyinstalledbefore
a teststarts.

Allengineswithin100feetofthewellborethatarerequiredto"run"duringthetestshallhave
sparkarrestersorwatercooledexhausts.
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b. TheloggingprogramwillconsistofaSchlumbergerPlatformExpress(orequivalent)tobe run
frombase ofsurfacecasingtoT.D.

c. Nocoresareanticipated.

d. Whetherthewell is completedas a dry hole or as a producer,"WellCompletionand
RecompletionReportandLog"(Form3160-4)willbe submittednotlaterthan30 daysafter
completionofthewelloraftercompletionofoperationsbeingperformed,inaccordancewith
43 CFR 3164. Twocopiesof all logs,coredescriptions,coreanalyses, well-testdata,
geologicsummaries,sampledescription,andallothersurveysordataobtainedandcompiled
duringthe drilling,workover,and/orcompletionoperations,willbe filedwithform3160-4.
Samples(cutting,fluide,°and/orgases0willbe submittedwhenrequestedbytheauthorized
officer(AO).

e. Theanticipatedcompletionprogramwillbeasfollows:Performmultistagefracsandcomplete
allproductiveBlackhawk,Mesaverdeand Wasatchzones presentinwellbore.Produceall
zones commingled.

f. Dailydrillingandcompletionprogressreportsshallbe submittedtotheBLMinVernalona
weeklybasis.

7. ABNORMALTEMPERATURESORPRESSURES

a. Theexpectedbottomholepressureis7266psi.Themaximumbottomholetemperaturewill
be 221degrees Fahrenheit.

b. Nohydrogensulfidegas isanticipated.AbnormalPressureswillbe controlledwiththemud
weight.

8. ANTICIPATEDSTARTINGDATESANDNOTIFICATIONOFOPERATIONS

a. Drillingis plannedtocommenceuponapprovalofthisapplication.

b. Itis anticipatedthatthedrillingofthiswellwilltakeapproximately35 days.
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c. The BLMinVernal,Utahshallbe notifiedoftheanticipateddate of locationconstruction
commencementandofanticipatedspuddate.

d. Nolocationwillbe constructedormoved,nowellwillbe plugged,andnodrillingorworkover
equipmentwillbe removedfroma welltobe placed in a suspendedstatuswithoutprior
approvaloftheAO. Ifoperationsare tobe suspended,priorapprovaloftheAOwillbe
obtainedandnotificationgivenbeforeresumptionofoperations.

e. The spuddate willbe reportedorallyto theAOwithin48 hours afterspudding. Ifthe
spuddingoccursonaweekendorholiday,thereportwillbesubmittedonthefollowingregular
workday. Theoralreportwillbe followedupwitha SundryNotice.

f. InaccordancewithOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,thiswellwillbe reportedonForm3160-
6 "MonthlyReportofOperations",startingwiththemonthinwhichoperationscommenceand
continueeachmonthuntilthewellisphysicallypluggedandabandoned.Thisreportwillbe
filedwiththeVernalBLMDistrictOffice,170South500 East,Vernal,UT 84078.

g. ImmediateReport:Spills,blowouts,fires,leaks,accidents,oranyotherunusualoccurrences
shallbe promptlyreportedinaccordancewiththerequirementsofNTL-3Aorits revision.

h. Ifa replacementrigiscontemplatedforcompletionoperations,a "SundryNotice"Form3160-
5 tothateffectwillbe filed,forpriorapprovaloftheAO,andallconditionsofthisapproved
planareapplicableduringalloperationsconductedwiththereplacementrig.

i. Shouldthewellbe successfullycompletedforproduction,theAOwillbe notifiedwhenthe
wellisplacedina producingstatus.Suchnotificationwillbe sentbytelegramorotherwritten
communications,notlaterthan5 days followingthe date onwhichthewellis placedon
production.

j. PursuanttoOnshoreOrderNo.7,withtheapprovaloftheDistrictEngineer,producedwater
maybe temporarilydisposedofintounlinedpitsfora periodofup to90 days. Duringthe
periodso authorized,an applicationforapprovalofthepermanentdisposalmethod,along
withthe requiredwateranalysisandotherinformation,mustbe submittedtotheDistrict
Engineer.
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k. PursuanttoNTL-4A,lessees oroperatorsareauthorizedtovent/flaregas duringinitialwell
evaluationtests,notexceedinga periodof30 days ortheproductionof50 MMCFofgas,
whicheveroccursfirst. Anapplicationmustbe filedwiththeDistrictEngineerandapproval
received,foranyventing/flaringofgas beyondtheinitial30dayorauthorizedtestperiod.

I. Aschematicfacilitiesdiagramas requiredby43CFR3162.7-5(b.9.d.),shallbesubmittedto
the appropriateDistrictOfficewithinsixty(60) days of installationor first production,
whicheveroccursfirst.Allsitesecurityregulationsas specifiedinOnshoreOrderNo.3 shall
be adheredto. Allproductlinesenteringand leavinghydrocarbonstoragetankswillbe
effectivelysealedinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.7-5(b.4.).

m. A firstproductionconferencewillbe scheduledwithin15 days afterreceiptof the first
productionnotice.

n. Nowellabandonmentoperationswillbe commencedwithoutthepriorapprovaloftheAO.
Inthecase ofnewlydrilleddryholesorfailures,andinemergencysituations,oralapproval
willbe obtainedfromtheSO. A"SubsequentReportofAbandonment"Form3160-5,willbe
filedwiththeAOwithin30daysfollowingcompletionofthewellforabandonment.Thisreport
willindicate whereplugswere placedandthecurrentstatusofsurfacerestoration.Final
abandonmentwillnot be approveduntilthe surfacereclamationworkrequiredby the
approvedAPDorapprovedabandonmentnoticehas been completedtothesatisfactionof
theAOorhisrepresentative,ortheappropriateSurfaceManagingAgency.

o. PursuanttoOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1, lessees andoperatorshavetheresponsibility
to see thattheirexploration,development,production,and constructionoperationsare
conductedinamannerwhichconformswithapplicableFederallawsandregulationsandwith
State and local laws and regulationsto theextentthatsuchState and local laws are
applicabletooperationsonFederalorIndianlands.

BureauofLandManagement
170South500 East
Vernal,Utah84078

Phone:435/781-4400 Fax:435/781-4410
AfterHours:

MattBaker PetroleumEngineer 435/828-4470

MichaelLee PetroleumEngineer 435/828-7875
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ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1
NOTIFICATIONREQUIREMENTS

LocationConstruction- forty-eight(48)hourspriortoconstructionoflocationand accessroads.

LocationCompletion- priortomovingonthedrillingrig.

SpudNotice - at leasttwenty-four(24)hourspriortospuddingthewell.

CasingStringand - twenty-four(24)hourspriortorunningcasingand
Cementing cementingallcasingstrings.

BOPandRelated - twenty-four(24)hourspriortoinitiatingpressuretests.
EquipmentTests

FirstProduction- withinfive(5)businessdays afternewwellbeginsor
Notice productionresumesafterwellhas been offproductionformorethan

ninety(90)days.

The onsiteinspectionforthesubjectwellsitewasconductedonTuesday,May22, 2007atapproximately
12:08p.m. Weatherconditionswerecoolandwindy.Inattendanceat theonsiteinspectionwerethe
followingindividuals:

DarrenWilliams NaturalResourceSpecialistBureauofLandManagement
BrandonMcDonald WildlifeBiologist BureauofLandManagement
RandySmith PermittingAgent PermitcoInc.
ShonMcKinnon Consultant GascoProductionCompany
Jesse Walton Surveyor UintahEngineeringandLandSurveying
BrianO'Hearn Ecologist SWCA

1. EXISTINGROADS

a. Theproposedwellsiteis locatedapproximately23.9milessoutheastofMyton,Utah.
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b. DirectionstothelocationfromMyton,Utahareas follows:

ProceedsouthwesterlyonHighway40for1.5miles.Turnleftandproceedsoutheasterly
forapproximately11milestotheCastlePeak Mine.Turnleftandproceedeastfor
approximately6.7 milesonthe8 MileFlatRoad. Turnrightandproceedsoutheasterlyon
an improvedroadfor4.7 miles.Turnleftontotheproposedaccessandproceednorth
320feet untilreachingtheproposedlocation.

c. Forlocationofaccessroadswithina 2-Mileradius,see MapsA&B.

d. Improvementtoexistingmainroadswillnotbe required.

e. Allexistingroadswillbe maintainedandkeptingoodrepairduringalldrillingand
completionoperationsassociatedwiththiswell.

f. Existingroadsandnewlyconstructedroadsonsurfaceunderthejurisdictionofany
SurfaceManagingAgencyshallbe maintainedinaccordancewiththestandardsofthe
SMA.

2. PLANNEDACCESSROADS

a. Approximately320feet ofroadwillbe newconstruction.

b. The maximumgradeofthenewconstructionwillbe approximately2%.

c. Noturnoutsareplanned.

d. Noculvertsor lowwatercrossingswillbe necessary.

e. The last320feet ofproposedaccessroadwascenterlineflaggedat thetimeofstaking.

f. The useofsurfacingmaterialis notanticipated,howeveritmaybe necessarydepending
onweatherconditions.

g. Nocattleguardswillbe installed.
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h. Surfacedisturbanceandvehiculartravelwillbe limitedtotheapprovedlocationand
approvedaccessroute.Anyadditionalareaneededwillbe approvedinadvance.

i. Accessroadsandsurfacedisturbingactivitieswillconformtostandardsoutlinedinthe
BureauofLandManagementandForestServicepublication:SurfaceOperating
StandardsforOilandGasExplorationandDevelopment,(1989).

j. The roadwillbe constructedlupgradedtomeetthestandardsoftheanticipatedtrafficflow
andallweatherroadrequirements.Constructionlupgradingshallincludeditching,
draining,graveling,crowingandcappingtheroadbedas necessarytoprovidea well
constructedsaferoad. Priortoupgrading,theroadshallbeclearedofanysnowcover
andallowedtodrycompletely.Travelingoffthe30 footright-of-waywillnotbe allowed.
Roaddrainagecrossingsshallbe ofthetypicaldrycreekdrainagecrossingtype.
Crossingsshallbe designedso theywillnotcausesiltationoraccumulationofdebrisin
thedrainagecrossingnorshallthedrainagesbe blockedbytheroadbed.Erosionof
drainageditchesbyrunoffwatershallbe preventedbydivertingwateroffat frequent
intervalsbymeansofcutouts.Upgradingshallnotbe allowedduringmuddyconditions.
Shouldmudholesdevelop,theyshallbe filledinanddetoursaroundthemavoided.

k. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitleIllinanamountequaltoorgreater
than10,000poundswillbe used,produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofannually
inassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell. Furthermore,noextremelyhazardous
substances,as definedin40 CFR355,inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used,
produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

l. Noroadrightofwayis neededsinceallnewaccessis locatedwiththelease boundary.

3. LOCATIONOFEXISTINGWELLSWITHINA1-MILERADIUSOFTHEPROPOSEDLOCATION.
(See Map"C")

a. Waterwells- none

b. Injectionwells- none

c. Producingwells- eleven

d. Drillingwells- none

e. Shut-inwells- one
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f. Temporarilyabandonedwells- none

g. Disposalwells-none

h. Abandonedwells- five

i. DryHoles- none

4. LOCATIONOFTANKBATTERIESANDPRODUCTIONFACILITIES.

a. Allpermanentstructures(onsiteforsixmonthsorlonger)constructedorinstalled
(includingoilwellpumpjacks)willbe paintedCovertGreen.Allfacilitieswillbe painted
withinsixmonthsofinstallation.FacilitiesrequiredtocomplywiththeOccupationalSafety
andHealthAct(OSHA)willbe excluded.

b. Ifstoragefacilities/tankbatteriesareconstructedonthislease, thefacility/batteryorthe
wellpadshallsurroundedbya containmentdikeofsufficientcapacitytocontainat a
minimum,theentirecontentsofthe largesttankwithinthefacilitylbattery,unlessmore
stringentprotectiverequirementsaredeemednecessarybytheauthorizedofficer.

c. Ifproductionis establisheda productionfacilitylayoutwillbe submittedviaSundryNotice.

d. Allloadinglineswillbe placedinsidethebermsurroundingthetankbattery.

e. Gasmeterrunsforeachwellwillbe locatedwithin500feetofthewellhead.Thegasflow
linewillbe buriedoranchoreddownfromthewellheadtotheseparator.Meterrunswillbe
housedand/orfenced.

f. Theoilandgas measurementfacilitieswillbe installedonthewelllocation.Theoiland
gasmeterswillbe calibratedinplacepriortoanydeliveries.Tests formeteraccuracywill
be conductedmonthlyforthefirstthreemonthsonnewmeterinstallationsandat least
quarterlythereafter.TheAOwillbe providedwitha date andtimefortheinitialmeter
calibrationandallfuturemeterprovingschedules.Acopyofthemetercalibrationreports
willbe submittedtotheVernalFieldOffice.Allmetermeasurementfacilitieswillconform
withOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.4 forliquidhydrocarbonsandOnshoreOilandGas
OrderNo.5 fornaturalgas measurement.
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g. Ifatanytimethefacilitieslocatedonpubliclandandauthorizedbythetermsofthelease
arenolongerincludedinthelease (duetoa contractionintheunitorotherlease orunit
boundarychange),BLMwillprocessa changeinauthorizationtotheappropriatestatute.
Theauthorizationwillbe subjecttoappropriaterentalorotherfinancialobligationas
determinedbytheauthorizedofficer.

h. Anynecessarypitswillbe properlyfencedtopreventanywildlifeentry.

i. Allsitesecurityguidelinesidentifiedin43 CFR3162.7regulationswillbe adheredto.

j. Alloff-leasestorage,off-leasemeasurement,orcomminglingon-leaseoroff-leasewill
haveprior'writtenapprovalfromtheDistrictManager.

k. AIIaccessroadswillbe maintainedas necessarytopreventerosionandaccommodate
year-roundtraffic.

I. The roadwillbe maintainedina safe useablecondition.

m. Producedwaterwillbe storedina 300bblheated, insulatedtank,thenhauledtoa
commercialdisposalsitesuchas DisposalInc.,orBrennanBottom.

n. PipelineswillfollowtherouteshownonMapD. See Pipelinedetailattached.Nopipeline
rightofwaywillbe necessary.

5. LOCATIONANDTYPEOFWATERSUPPLY

a. Theproposedwatersourcewillbe theNebeckerWaterServiceattheNebeckerWater
StationinMyton,permit#43-1721.

b. Waterwillbe hauledbyNebeckerWaterServicetothelocationovertheaccessroads
shownonMapsAandB.

c. Nowaterwellwillbe drilledonthislease.

6. SOURCEOFCONSTRUCTIONMATERIAL

a. Surfaceandsubsoilmaterialsintheimmediateareawillbe utilized.

b. Anygravelusedwillbe obtainedfroma commercialsource. , ,
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c. Theuse ofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformwith43 CFR3610.2.3.
Constructionmaterialwillnotbe locatedon lease.

d. Noconstructionmaterialswillbe removedfromFederalland.

7. METHODSOFHANDLINGWASTEDISPOSAL

a. The reservepitwillbe constructedsoas nottoleak,break,orallowdischarge.

b. AttherequestoftheBLM,thereservepitwillbe linedwitha 12milliner. Iffracturedrock
is encountered,thepitwillbefirstlinedwithsufficientbedding(eitherstrawor dirt)tocover
any rocks. Thelinerwilloverlapthepitwallsandbe coveredwithdirtand/orrockstohold
itinplace.Notrash,scrappipe,etc.,thatcouldpuncturethelinerwillbe disposedofin
thepit. Morestringentprotectiverequirementsmaybe deemed necessarybytheA.O.

c. Burningwillnotbe allowed.Alltrashwillbe containedina trashcageand itscontents
removedat theendofdrillingoperationsandhauledtoanapproveddisposalsight.

d. Afterfirstproduction,producedwastewaterwillbe confinedtoa unlinedpitorstoragetank
fora periodnottoexceedninety(90)days. Duringthe90-dayperiod,inaccordancewith
OnshoreOrderNo.7, anapplicationforapprovalofa permanentdisposalmethodand
location,alongwiththerequiredwateranalysis,willbe submittedfortheAO'sapproval.
Failuretofileanapplicationwithinthetimeallowedwillbe consideredan incidentof
noncompliance.

e. Drillcuttingsaretobe containedandburiedinthereservepit.

f. Anysaltsand/orchemicalswhicharean integralpartofthedrillingsystemwillbe disposed
ofinthesamemanneras thedrillingfluid.

g. Achemicalporta-toiletwillbe furnishedwiththedrillingrig.

h. The producedfluidswillbe producedintoa testtankuntilsuchtimeas constructionof
productionfacilitiesis completed.Anyspillsofoil,gassaltwaterorotherproducedfluids
willbe cleanedup andremoved.
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8. ANCILLARYFACILITIES

Therearenoairstrips,camps,orotherfacilitiesplannedduringthedrillingoftheproposedwell.

9. WELLSITELAYOUT

a. Theoperatororhis/hercontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficeat 435/781-4400forty-eight
(48)hourspriortoconstructionactivities.

b. The reservepitwillbe locatedonthesouthsideofthelocation.

c. Theflarepitwillbe locatedonthewestsideofthereservepit, a minimumof 100feetfrom
thewellhead and30feetfromthereservepitfence.

d. Thestockpiledtopsoil(firstsixinches)willbe storedonthenorthsideofthe location,
betweenCorners2 and9 nearthewellpad.Topsoilalongtheaccessroutewillbe wind
rowedontheuphillside.

e. Accesstothewellpadwillbe fromthesouthasshownonthePit&Pad Layout.

f. See LocationLayoutfororientationofrig,crosssectionofdrillpadandcutsandfills.

g. The locationofmudtanks;reservepit,trashcage;piperacks;livingfacilitiesandsoil
stockpileswillbe shownontheLocationLayout.

h. Allpitswillbe fencedaccordingtothefollowingminimumstandards:

1. 39 inchnetwireshallbe usedwithat leastonestrandorbarbedwireontopofthe
netwire(barbedwireis notnecessaryifpipeorsometypeofreinforcementrodis
attachedtothetopoftheentirefence).

2. The netwireshallbe nomorethan2-inchesabovetheground.Thebarbedwire
shallbe 3-inchesabovethenetwire. Totalheightofthefenceshallbe at least42-
inches.
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3. Cornerpostsshallbe cementedand/orbracedinsucha mannertokeepthefence
tightat alltimes.

4. Standardsteel,wood,orpipepostsshallbe usedbetweenthecornerbraces.
Maximumdistancebetweenanytwopostsshallbe nogreaterthan16feet.

5. Allwireshallbe stretched,byusinga stretchingdevice,beforeitis attachedtothe
cornerposts.

i. The reservepitfencingwillbe onthreesidesduringdrillingoperationsandonthefourth
sidewhentherigmovesoffthe location.Pitswillbe fencedandmaintaineduntilcleanup.

10. PLANSFORRESTORATIONOFSURFACE

ProducingLocation

a. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,thelocationandsurroundingareawillbeclearedofall
unusedtubing,equipment,debris,materials,trashandjunknotrequiredforproduction.

b. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,anyhydrocarbonsonthepitshallbe removedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.7-1.

c. Ifa plasticnylonreinforcedlineris useditshallbe tornandperforatedbeforebackfillingof
thereservepit.

d. The reservepitandthatportionofthelocationnotneededforproductionfacilitiesor
operationswillbe recontouredtotheapproximatenaturalcontours.The reservepitwillbe
reclaimedwithin120days fromthedate ofwellcompletion.Beforeanydirtworktakes
place,thereservepitmusthave allfluidsandhydrocarbonsremovedandallcans,barrels,
pipe,etc.,willbe removed.

e. Reclamationofunuseddisturbedareasonthewellpadlaccessroadnolongerneededfor
operations,suchas cutslopes,andfillareaswillbe accomplishedbygrading,levelingand
seedingas recommendedbytheAuthorizedOfficer.Aseedmixturewillbe specifiedby
theBureauofLandManagementintheirConditionsofApprovalforthesubjectwell.
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Seedingwillbe performedimmediatelyafterthelocationhas been reclaimedandthepit
has been backfilled,regardlessofthetimeofyear. Seedwillbe broadcastandwalkedin
witha dozer.

f. The topsoilstockpilewillbe seededas soonas thelocationhas been constructedwiththe
samerecommendedseedmix.Theseedwillbe walkedinwitha cat.

g. The seedmixturewillbe recommendedbytheBLM.

DryHole

h. Atsuchtimeas thewellis pluggedandabandoned,theoperatorshallsubmita
subsequentreportofabandonmentandBLMwillattachtheappropriatesurface
rehabilitationconditionsofapproval.

11. SURFACEOWNERSHIP

Access Roads - ThemajorityoftheaccessroadsaremaintainedbytheCountyRoadDepartment
ortheBureauofLandManagement.

Wellpad - Thewellpad is locatedonlandsmanagedbytheBLM.

12. OTHERINFORMATION

a. AClassIIIarcheologicalsurveyhas been conductedbyGrandRiverandisattached(GRI
ProjectNo.2722,datedApril23, 2007).

b. APaleontologicalEvaluationwasdonebyAldenHamblinonApril16,2007. Acopyofthe
reportis a#ached.

c. Theoperatoris responsibleforinformingallpersonsintheareaswhoareassociatedwith
thisprojectthattheywillbe subjecttoprosecutionforknowinglydisturbinghistoricor
archaeologicalsites,orforcollectingartifacts.Ifhistoricorarchaeologicalmaterialsare
uncoveredduringconstruction,theoperatoris to immediatelystopworkthatmightfurther
disturbsuchmaterials,andcontacttheauthorizedofficer(AO).Withinfiveworkingdays
theAOwillinformtheoperatoras to:
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-whether thematerialsappeareligiblefortheNationalRegisterofHistoricPlaces;

-the mitigationmeasurestheoperatorwilllikelyhavetoundertakebeforethesitecanbe
used (assuminginsitupreservationis notnecessary);and

-a timeframefortheAOtocompleteandexpeditedreviewunder36 CFR800.11to
confirm,throughtheStateHistoricPreservationOfficer,thatthefindingsoftheAOare
correctandthatmitigationis appropriate.Iftheoperatorwishes,atanytime,torelocate
activitiestoavoidtheexpenseofmitigationand/orthedelaysassociatedwiththisprocess,
theAOwillassumeresponsibilityforwhateverrecordationandstabilizationoftheexposed
materialsmaybe required.Otherwise,theoperatorwillbe responsibleformitigationcosts.
TheAOwillprovidetechnicalandproceduralguidelinesfortheconductofmitigation.
UponverificationfromtheAOthatrequiredmitigationhas been completed,theoperator
willthenbe allowedtoresumeconstruction.

d. Theoperatorwillcontrolnoxiousweedsalongrights-of-wayforroads,pipelines,wellsites,
orotherapplicablefacilities.Alistofnoxiousweeds maybe obtainedfromtheBLM,orthe
appropriateCountyExtensionOffice.OnBLMadministeredlanditis requiredthata
PesticideUseProposalshallbe submitted,andgivenapproval,priortotheapplicationof
herbicidesorotherpesticidesorpossiblehazardouschemicals.

e. Drillingrigsand/orequipmentusedduringdrillingoperationsonthiswellsitewillnotbe
stackedorstoredonFederalLandsaftertheconclusionofdrillingoperationsorat any
othertimewithoutBLMauthorization.However,ifBLMauthorizationis obtained,it is only
a temporarymeasure.

f. Alllease and/orunitoperationswillbe conductedinsucha mannerthatfullcomplianceis
madewithallapplicablelaws,regulations,OnshoreOilandGasOrders,theapproved
planofoperations,andanyapplicableNoticetoLessees. Theoperatorisfullyresponsible
fortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe furnishedthefield
representativetoinsurecompliance.

g. AcompletecopyoftheapprovedAPDshallbe onlocationduringconstructionofthe
locationanddrillingactivities.

h. There willbe nodeviationfromtheproposeddrillingand/orworkoverprogramwithout
priorapprovalfromtheAO. Safedrillingandoperatingpracticesmustbe observed.All
wells,whetherdrilling,producing,suspendedorabandonedwillbe identifiedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.
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i. "SundryNoticeandReportonWells"(Form3160-5)willbe filedforapprovalforall
changesofplansandotheroperationsinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.3-2.

j. Thispermitwillbe validfora periodoftwoyears fromthedate ofapproval.Anextension
periodmaybe granted,ifrequested,priortotheexpirationoftheoriginalapprovalperiod.
Afterpermittermination,a newapplicationwillbe filedforapprovalforanyfuture
operations.

k. TheoperatororhiscontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficesat 435/781-440048 hours
priortoconstructionactivities.

l. The BLMOfficeshallbe notifieduponsitecompletionpriortomovingonthedrillingrig.

13. LESSEE'SOROPERATOR'SREPRESENTATIVE

PermitMatters Drilling&CompletionMatters

PERMITC0INC. Gasco Production Company
14421CountyRoad10 8 InvernessDriveEast,Suite100
Ft.Lupton,CO80621 Englewood,CO80112
303/857-9999(0) John Longwell
303/857-0577(F) 303/483-0044(0)
LisaSmith 303/483-0011(F)

ShawnElworthy- FieldSuperintendent
Roosevelt,UT
435-823-4272(cell)
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PIPELINEINFORMATION
SheepWashFederal#31-25-9-18

1. The typeofpipelineisa singlewellflowline.

2. Theoutsidediameter(O.D.)ofallwillbe 8 inchesmaximum.

3. Theanticipatedproductionthroughthelineisapproximately2000MCFperday.

4. Theanticipatedmaximumtestpressureis 1000psi.

5. Theanticipatedoperatingpressureis 100-200psi.

6. The typeofpipeis steel.

7. The methodofcouplingis welded.

8. The pipelinewillbe laidonsurfacebecause oftheextremelyrockysurface.

9. Therearenootherpipelinestobe associatedinsame rightofway.

10. Therewillbe otherobjectstobe associatedin the samerightofway.(Risers,Pig LaunchersPig
Traps,metersandotherappurtenancesas required.)

11. The totallengthofpipelineis approximately249' - see MapD.

12. Wherepossible,thepipelinewillfollowexistingorproposedroads.

13. Theconstructionwidthfortotalsurfacedisturbingactivitiesis 30 feet.

14. Theestimatedtotalacreageinvolvingallsurfacedisturbingactivitiesis 0.17totalacres.

15. Anysurfacedisturbancecreatedas a resultofthepipelineconstructionwillbe reclaimedutilizingthe
reclamationproceduresandseedmixturespecifiedbytheBureauofLandManagement.

16. The linewillbe testedwithgaspressureto1000psi.
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FEDERALSTIPULATIONSANDTIMINGRESTRICTIONS

Therewillbe nodrillingfromMay15*throughJune 15*fortheprotectionofMountainPlover.

Therewillbe nodrillingfromApril16throughAugust15*fortheprotectionofBurrowingOwl.
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Abstract

Grand River Institute conducted a Class III cultural resources inventory for Gasco

Production Company of fourteen proposed well locations (Fed. #13-18-9-19, Fed. #11-19-9-

19, Fed. #13-19-9-19, Sheep Wash Fed. #11-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #31-25-9-18, Sheep

Wash Fed. #12-26-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #14-26-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #43-33-9-18,

Uteland Fed. #32-3-10-18, Uteland Fed. #43-3-10-18, Uteland Fed. #14-10-10-18, Fed. #41-

1-10-18, Fed. #31-6-10-19, and State #22-32A, #21-32B, & #21-32A) and 2.74 miles of

linear routes (roads and/or pipelines) in Uintah County, Utah, under BLM Antiquities Permit

No. 07UT-54939 and Utah Division of State History (UDSH) Project Authorization No.
UO7-GB-0032b,s. This work was done to meet requirements of Federal and State laws that

protect cultural
resourt°es.

Files searches conducted through the BLM Vernal District Office (BLM) and

through the UDSH indicated two sites (42UN2290 and 42UN2844) were previously

recorded near two of the project's discrete areas. Field work was performed between the
186 and 216'of April 2007. A total of about 206.5 acres (BLM 188, State 18.5) was

inspected. The two previouslyrecorded sites were relocated as part of this project and found

to lie outside impact areas, so no further work is recommended for them. Three isolated

finds and one site (42UN5806) were newly recorded. The site was field evaluated as

significant and eligible for listing on the National Register of Historic Places. It is presently

within the impact area for the proposed new road to the Fed. #43-3-10-18 well location and

should be avoided. An alternate route was inventoried to the east of the originally flagged

road to allow for its movement in that direction.
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Introduction

At the request of Gasco Production Company and the Bureau of Land Management

Vernal Field Office (BLM), Grand River Institute conducted a Class III cultural resources

inventory for Gasco Production Company of fourteen proposed well locations (Fed. #13-18-

9-19, Fed. #11-19-9-19, Fed. #13-19-9-19, Sheep Wash Fed. #11-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed.
#31-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #12-26-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #14-26-9-18, Sheep Wash

Fed. #43-33-9-18, Uteland Fed. #32-3-10-18, Uteland Fed. #43-3-10-18, Uteland Fed. #14-

10-10-18, Fed. #41-1-10-18, Fed. #31-6-10-19, and State #22-32A, #21-32B, &#21-32A)

and 2.74 miles of linear routes (roads and/or pipelines) in Uintah County, Utah, under BLM

Antiquities Permit No. 07UT-54939 and Utah Division of State History (UDSH) Project

Authorization No. UO7-GB-0032b,s. The file searches, survey and report were completed by

Carl E. Cormer (Principal Investigator) and Barbara J. Davenport of GRI. Field work was

performed between the 186 and 21" of April 2007. A total of about 206.5 acres (BLM 188,

State 18.5) was inspected.

The survey was done to meet requirements of the Federal Land Policy and
Management Act of 1976, the National Historic Preservation Act as amended in 1992, and

the National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) of 1969. These laws are concerned with the

identification, evaluation, and protection of fragile, non-renewable evidences of human

activity, occupation and endeavor reflected in districts, sites, structures, artifacts, objects,

ruins, works of art, architecture, and natural featuresthat were of importancein human
events. Such resources tend to be localized and highly sensitive to disturbance.

Location of Project Area

The study area's discrete units lie southwest of Vernal, Utah, in the Sheep Wash/

Uteland Butte area of Uintah County. The 10-acre blocks surveyed for the proposed new

well locations, and the 200-foot-wide corridors inventoried for the proposed new access

roads and/or pipeline routes are in T. 9 S., R. 18 E.,.Sections 25, 26, 33 and 36; and, T. 9 S.,

R. 19 E., Sections 18, 19 and 32; T. 10 S., R. 18 E., Sections 1, 3 and 10; T. 10 S., R. 19 E.,

Section 6; SLBM.

Environment

The project areas are within the major geologic subdivision of the Colorado Plateau

known as the Uinta Basin Section. In Utah, this section extends from the Uinta Mountains

on the north to the Book Cliffs on the south. It is a broad downwarp into which Quaternary-
and Tertiary-age deposits were made from the surrounding mountains which include

Holocene and Pleistocene pediment deposits, and Eocene-age fluvial and lacustrine

sedimentary rocks (Rigby 1976:xi). Physiographically, the basin includes the Uinta basin in

the north portion and the Book Cliffs/Roan Plateau in the south portion. The lower Uinta
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Figure 1. Prefield area map (lof3) for the Class III cultural resources inventory of 16 proposed Federal and
State well locations and short new accesses in the Sheep Wash and Uteland Butte areas of Uintah County, Utah,
for Gasco Production Co. Areas to be surveyed are indicated. [Grand River Institute #2722, April
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Figure 2. Prefield area map (2 of3) for the Class III cultural resources inventory of 16 proposed Federal and
State well locations and short new accesses in the Sheep Wash and Uteland Butte areas of Uintah County, Utah,
for Gasco Production Co. Areas to be surveyed are indicated. [Grand River Institute #2722, April
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Formation is the bedrock of the study area. Holocene and Pleistocene-age alluvium and

colluvium occur as a veneer over the Uinta. It consists of channel and flood-plain stream
deposits. Soils encountered were rocky, shaley, silty, and sandy loams, which are in general
formed in residuum from the underlying formation. However, dunes are common in this
region as well.

Elevations in the project area range from 4780-to-4950 feet. The terrain is
characterized as bench land that is cut by dendritic washes. Vegetation is a shadscale desert
community throughout most of the area. Notably, Indian Ricegrass occurs on the stabilized
dunes that border many of the small buttes in the area, and may have been a significant
source of food for the native inhabitants. Regional faunal inhabitants include deer, antelope,

elk, black bear, coyote, mountain lion, cottontails, jack rabbits, and various raptores.

A cool, mid-latitude steppe climate prevails. Annual precipitation of this elevation
range is between 7 and 10 inches. Temperatures range from 100°F in the summer to -40°F

in January. Paleoenvironmental data are scant, but it is generally agreed that gross climatic

conditions have remained fairly constant over the last 12,000 years. However, changes in
effective moisture, and cooling-warming trends probably affected the prehistoric occupation

of the region.

Files Search

Files searches were conducted through BLM and UDSH. Previous projects in the
areas near the inventory blocks and linear routes are numerous and generally relate to oil and
gas development. Those that are adjacent to the project areas are discussed below.

Numerous projects have been completed in the Sections indicated in the Location of

Project portion of the report. Significant to this report are those projects shown on Figures
1-3, including: U92-SJ-126b,s, U96-SJ-379b,s, U01-MQ-694b,U02-AY-693b, UO4-GB-

1081b,s, UO5-GB-236b, UO5-ST-441b, UO6-GB-119b, 06-MQ-0657b,i,p,s.As part of U96-

SJ-379b,s two sites (42UN2290 and 42UN2291) were recorded along the existing access

road to the connecting, proposed new access roads to the Uteland Fed. #32-3-10-18 and the
Uteland Fed. #43-3-10-18. Both of the sites were apparently avoided by the previous
construction of the existing access. Site 42UN2290, a prehistoric open camp that was

previously evaluated as significant, is close to the proposed access to the #32-3, so it was

revisited by the currant project to determine its relationship to the proposed action. In
addition, site 42UN2844, a cairn recorded as part of #U-01-MM-0411, was originally
recorded within the impact area of the proposed Fed. #41-1-10-18 well location, and was

also relocated as part of this project.

Regional archaeological studies suggest nearly continuous human occupation of

northeastern Utah for the past 12,000 years. Evidence of the Paleoindian Tradition, the
Archaic Tradition, Fremont Culture, and Protohistoric/Historic Utes has been found.
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Historic records suggest occupation or use by EuroAmerican trappers, settlers, miners, and

ranchers as well. Overviews of the prehistory and history of the region are provided in the
Utah BLM Cultural Resource Series No. 11, Archaeological Inventory in the Seep Ridge
Cultural Study Tract, Uintah County, Northeastern Utah with a Regional Predictive Model
for Site Locations (Chandler and Larralde 1980), and in Cultural Resources Existing Data
Inventory Vernal District, Utah (Jones and Mackay 1980).

Study Objectives

The purpose of the study was to identify and record all cultural resources within the
areas of potential impact and to assess their significance and eligibility to the National
Register of Historic Places (NRHP). The statements of significance included in this report
are field assessments made in support of recommendations to the BLM and State Historic
Preservation Officer (SHPO), and the final determination of site significance is made by the
BLM in consultation with the SHPO.

Paleontological resources were also considered in the inspection. However, a final
evaluation of those resources must be provided by a paleontologist permitted by Utah.

Field Methods

A Class III, 100% pedestrian, cultural resources survey of the proposed well

locations was made by walking a series of concentric circles (spaced at 15m intervals)
around the flagged centers to diameters of 750 feet. The related access and pipeline routes

not included within the 10-acre study plots or the previous survey areas were surveyed by
walking four parallel transects spaced at 15m intervals and centered on the flagged lines to
cover corridors 200 feet wide.

Cultural resources were sought as surface exposures and were characterized as sites
or isolated finds. Sites were defined by the presence of six or more artifacts and/or

significant feature(s) indicative of patterned human activity. Isolated finds were defined by
the presence of 1 to 5 artifacts apparently of surficial nature. Cultural resources encountered

were to be recorded to standards set by the Utah Division of State History (UDSH).

The basic approach to the data collection was the continuous mapping of observed
artifacts and features by recording UTM coordinates (NAD 83 Datum) using a Trimble Geo
XT. Site maps were created using corrected data and ARCMAP. Photographs were to be
taken at each site and to include general views and specific artifacts or features. Field notes

and photo negatives are filed at GrandRiver Institute, while the photographs are submitted
to the BLM and UDSH. No artifacts were collected.

Historic records suggest occupation or use by EuroAmerican trappers, settlers, miners, and
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Paleontological resources were also considered in the inspection. However, a final
evaluation of those resources must be provided by a paleontologist permitted by Utah.

Field Methods

A Class III, 100% pedestrian, cultural resources survey of the proposed well

locations was made by walking a series of concentric circles (spaced at 15m intervals)
around the flagged centers to diameters of 750 feet. The related access and pipeline routes

not included within the 10-acre study plots or the previous survey areas were surveyed by
walking four parallel transects spaced at 15m intervals and centered on the flagged lines to
cover corridors 200 feet wide.

Cultural resources were sought as surface exposures and were characterized as sites
or isolated finds. Sites were defined by the presence of six or more artifacts and/or

significant feature(s) indicative of patterned human activity. Isolated finds were defined by
the presence of 1 to 5 artifacts apparently of surficial nature. Cultural resources encountered

were to be recorded to standards set by the Utah Division of State History (UDSH).

The basic approach to the data collection was the continuous mapping of observed
artifacts and features by recording UTM coordinates (NAD 83 Datum) using a Trimble Geo
XT. Site maps were created using corrected data and ARCMAP. Photographs were to be
taken at each site and to include general views and specific artifacts or features. Field notes

and photo negatives are filed at GrandRiver Institute, while the photographs are submitted
to the BLM and UDSH. No artifacts were collected.



Study Findings

As expected, cultural resources were encountered during the survey. Three isolated
finds and one site (42UN5806) were newly recorded. Previously recorded sites 42UN2290
and 42UN2844 were revisited to ascertain their relationship to the proposed well locations.
No paleontological resources were found. This portion of the report presents a discussion of
site significance evaluation, describes the sites and provides their field evaluations, and lists
the isolated finds. Appendix A contains the resources' location data and the IMACS site
forms.

Site Significance

The National Historic Preservation Act of 1966 (NHPA) directs federal agencies to
ensure that federally-initiated or authorized actions do not inadvertently disturb or destroy

. significant.cultural resource values. Significance is a quality of cultural resource properties
that qualifies them for inclusion in the NRHP. The statements of significance included in
this report are field assessments to support recommendations to the BLM and State Historic
Preservation Officer (SHPO). The final determination of site significance is made by the
controlling agencies in consultation with the SHPO and the Keeper of the Register.

The Code of Federal Regulations was used as a guide for the in-field site evaluations.
Titles 36 CFR 50, 36 CFR 800, and 36 CFR 64 are concerned with the conceptsof
significance and (possible) historic value of cultural resources. Titles 36 CFR 65 and 36
CFR 66 provide standards for the conduct of significant and scientific data recovery
activities. Finally, Title 36 CFR 60.4 establishes the measure of significance that is critical
to the determination of a site's NRHP eligibility, which is used to assess a site's research
potential:

The quality of significance in American history, architecture, archaeology, and culture is
present in districts, sites, buildings, structures, and objects of State and local importance that
possess integrity of location, design, setting, materials, workmanship, feeling, and
association, and a) that are associated with events that have made a significant contribution
to the broad patterns of history; or b) that are associated with the lives of persons significant
in our past; or c) that embody the distinctive characteristics of a type, period, or method of
construction, or that represent the work of a master, or that possess high artistic values, or
that represent a significant and distinguishable entity whose components may lack
individual distinction; or d) that have yielded, or may be likely to yield, information
important in the prehistory or history.

Site Descriptions

Site 42UN2290 is a prehistoric.lithic scatter that was originally recorded in 1996 by
Christensen, Weymouth and King of Sagebrush Archaeological Consultants with project
#U-96-SJ-0379b,s. At that time the site was described "as a low density prehistoric lithic
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scatter with two hearth features (Hl and H2) located on a low, gently sloping bench above
Desert Spring Wash. The site measures 10m (32.8 feet) northwest-southeast by 12m (39.36

feet) northeast-southwest.

The exposed lithic assemblage reflects primary and secondary core reduction of
quartz, white quartzite and thermally and non-thermally altered orange, white, tan, and grey
cherts. Grey and tan chert cobbles eroding from the landform were noted, and may have
been thermally altered for on-site reduction. Hl, a stone slab lined fire hearth, survives,
in excellent condition. This circular feature consists of local tabular sandstone and angular

sedimentary fire-cracked-rock (FCR) and possesses an inner diameter of 57cm (22.4). H2 is

a possible deflated fire hearth or FCR scatter. No charcoal or carbon staining of surrounding
sediments was observed. No temporally diagnostic artifacts were observed, however H1 has
CI* datingpotential due to its high degree of archaeological integrity."

The site was relocated with the present project. New UTM coordinates and photos
were taken and a new map generated. The site appears in much the same condition as

originally recorded, despite the passage of 11 years since that time. The upgraded access

road was also mapped in, and has to date, avoided impacting the site. Accordingly, no

changes are made to its original recommendation as a significant site.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
The site is field evaluated as significant. Although partially deflatedby erosion,

subsurface depth of cultural fill is likely and the site may contribute additional important
information to the prehistory of the area. Presently, it lies 21 meters southeast of the edge of

the existing road and will not be directly affected by the proposed new access to the Uteland

Federal #32-3-10-18 well location (which will be located on the northwest side of the

existing road). Accordingly, no further work is necessary.

Site 42UN2844 was originally recorded in 2001 by L. Travis of Metcalf
Archaeological Consultants in conjunction with an access road upgrade project #U-01-MM-

0411. The site was described at that time as a cairn and three flakes.

The site was relocated with the present project, new UTM coordinates and photos

were taken and a new map generated. The cairn appears to be partially collapsed since its

original recording and the previously noted flakes were not found. The site was originally

unevaluated.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
The site is field evaluated as non-significant and not likely to contribute additional

historic information. The site lies outside the 10-acre survey area for the proposed Federal
#41-1-10-18 well location and will not be directly affected by the proposed project.
Accordingly, no further work is necessary.

scatter with two hearth features (Hl and H2) located on a low, gently sloping bench above
Desert Spring Wash. The site measures 10m (32.8 feet) northwest-southeast by 12m (39.36

feet) northeast-southwest.

The exposed lithic assemblage reflects primary and secondary core reduction of
quartz, white quartzite and thermally and non-thermally altered orange, white, tan, and grey
cherts. Grey and tan chert cobbles eroding from the landform were noted, and may have
been thermally altered for on-site reduction. Hl, a stone slab lined fire hearth, survives,
in excellent condition. This circular feature consists of local tabular sandstone and angular

sedimentary fire-cracked-rock (FCR) and possesses an inner diameter of 57cm (22.4). H2 is

a possible deflated fire hearth or FCR scatter. No charcoal or carbon staining of surrounding
sediments was observed. No temporally diagnostic artifacts were observed, however H1 has
CI* datingpotential due to its high degree of archaeological integrity."

The site was relocated with the present project. New UTM coordinates and photos
were taken and a new map generated. The site appears in much the same condition as

originally recorded, despite the passage of 11 years since that time. The upgraded access

road was also mapped in, and has to date, avoided impacting the site. Accordingly, no

changes are made to its original recommendation as a significant site.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
The site is field evaluated as significant. Although partially deflatedby erosion,

subsurface depth of cultural fill is likely and the site may contribute additional important
information to the prehistory of the area. Presently, it lies 21 meters southeast of the edge of

the existing road and will not be directly affected by the proposed new access to the Uteland

Federal #32-3-10-18 well location (which will be located on the northwest side of the

existing road). Accordingly, no further work is necessary.

Site 42UN2844 was originally recorded in 2001 by L. Travis of Metcalf
Archaeological Consultants in conjunction with an access road upgrade project #U-01-MM-

0411. The site was described at that time as a cairn and three flakes.

The site was relocated with the present project, new UTM coordinates and photos

were taken and a new map generated. The cairn appears to be partially collapsed since its

original recording and the previously noted flakes were not found. The site was originally

unevaluated.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
The site is field evaluated as non-significant and not likely to contribute additional

historic information. The site lies outside the 10-acre survey area for the proposed Federal
#41-1-10-18 well location and will not be directly affected by the proposed project.
Accordingly, no further work is necessary.



Site 42UN5806 is a prehistoric open lithic site located in the bottom of Desert

Springs Wash at 4660 feet elevation. The site is situated in a sand shadow on the east side

of a low ridge, south of the main drainage. Vegetation is desert shadscale with four-wing

saltbush. Nearby, the main drainage contains tamarisk and water is near the surface in this

area. Two other sites have been previously recorded (42UN2290 and 42UN2291) in the near

vicinity and are likely present due to the access to water in the main drainage.

The site measures approximately 27 meters by 15 meters. Artifacts consist of two

scrapers, one drill and a flake. The scrapers are both of porcellanite,one on a natural blade

with a single utilized edge. The drill measures 4.56 x 2.0cm and is of white opalitic chert.

The flake is a small, secondary opalitic variety of chert. No thermal or architectural features

were observed. However, since the site is located in an area of accumulated soil deposits

and artifacts are apparently eroding from those soils, subsurface depth of cultural fill may be

present. In light of this possibility, the site is field evaluated as significant.

Evaluation ancÏManagement Recommendation
The site is field evaluated as significant. Subsurface depth of cultural fill is likely

and may contribute additional important information to the prehistory of the area. It is

presently within the impact area for the proposed new road to the Fed. #43-3-10-18 well

location and should be avoided. An alternate route was inventoried to the east of the

originally flagged road to allow for its movement in that direction.

Table 1. List of Isolated Finds

Number Type

IF #1 2 scrapers: 1 very large, quartzite; 1
small, endscraper with chert

IF#2 Mano, cobble, sandstone

IF #3
Flake, medium-sized, mudstone

Summary of Site Evaluations and Management Recommendations

The eligibility determination and consultation process is guided by Section 106 of the

NHPA (36 CFR 60, 63, and 800). Inventory to identify, evaluate, and mitigate potential

effects to cultural resources affected by an undertaking is the first step in the Section 106

Site 42UN5806 is a prehistoric open lithic site located in the bottom of Desert

Springs Wash at 4660 feet elevation. The site is situated in a sand shadow on the east side

of a low ridge, south of the main drainage. Vegetation is desert shadscale with four-wing

saltbush. Nearby, the main drainage contains tamarisk and water is near the surface in this

area. Two other sites have been previously recorded (42UN2290 and 42UN2291) in the near

vicinity and are likely present due to the access to water in the main drainage.

The site measures approximately 27 meters by 15 meters. Artifacts consist of two

scrapers, one drill and a flake. The scrapers are both of porcellanite,one on a natural blade

with a single utilized edge. The drill measures 4.56 x 2.0cm and is of white opalitic chert.

The flake is a small, secondary opalitic variety of chert. No thermal or architectural features

were observed. However, since the site is located in an area of accumulated soil deposits

and artifacts are apparently eroding from those soils, subsurface depth of cultural fill may be

present. In light of this possibility, the site is field evaluated as significant.

Evaluation ancÏManagement Recommendation
The site is field evaluated as significant. Subsurface depth of cultural fill is likely

and may contribute additional important information to the prehistory of the area. It is

presently within the impact area for the proposed new road to the Fed. #43-3-10-18 well

location and should be avoided. An alternate route was inventoried to the east of the

originally flagged road to allow for its movement in that direction.

Table 1. List of Isolated Finds

Number Type

IF #1 2 scrapers: 1 very large, quartzite; 1
small, endscraper with chert

IF#2 Mano, cobble, sandstone

IF #3
Flake, medium-sized, mudstone

Summary of Site Evaluations and Management Recommendations

The eligibility determination and consultation process is guided by Section 106 of the

NHPA (36 CFR 60, 63, and 800). Inventory to identify, evaluate, and mitigate potential

effects to cultural resources affected by an undertaking is the first step in the Section 106



process. BLM actions cannot be authorized until the Section 106 process is completed (36

CFR 800.3). In brief, the inventory recorded two prehistoric lithic scatters and two isolated

finds.

As indicated by the files searches, two sites (42UN2290 and 42UN2844) were
previously recorded near or within two of the project's discrete areas. The two previously

recorded sites were relocated as part of this project and found to lie outside impact areas, so

no further work is recommended for them. Three isolated finds and one site (42UNS806)

were newly recorded. The site was field evaluated as significant and eligible for listing on

the National Register of Historic Places. It is presently within the impact area for the
proposed new road to the Fed. #43-3-10-18 well location and should be avoided. An

alternate route was inventoried to the east of the originally flagged road to allow for its

movement in that direction.
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Table A-1. Location data for cultural resources.

Number Type UTM Location (NAD83)

42UN2290 Open camp 12; 596152mE; 4425494mN

42UN2844 Cairn 12; 599684mE; 4426159mN

42DN5806 Open Lithic 12; 596340mE; 4425500mN

2 scrapers: 1 very large,
IF #1 quartzite; 1 small, 12; 599753mE; 4431615mN

endscraper with chert

IF#2 Mano, cobble, sandstone 12; 599865mE; 4431581mN

IF #3
Flake, medium-sized'

12; 599859mE; 4430802mN
mudstone
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PALEONTOLOGY EVALUATION SHEET

PROJECT: GASCO ENERGY Well - Sheep Wash Federal #31-25-9-18

LOCATION: Twenty miles south, southeast of Roosevelt, Utah in 853' FNL 2132' FEL Section
18, T 9S, R 19 E, Uinta County, Utah

OWNERSHIP: PRIV[ ] STATE[ ] BLM[ X ] USFS[ ] NPS[ ] IND[ ] MIL[ ] OTHER[ ]

DATE: April 16, 2007

GEOLOGY/TOPOGRAPHY: Rock exposures are sandstones and mudstones of the upper part of
the lower member of the Uinta Formation, Upper Eocene age. The well location is on a sand
covered area with a gentle slope to the north-northeast. Short road and pipeline.

PALEONTOLOGY SURVEY: YES [ ] NO Survey [ ] PARTIAL Survey [ X ]
Surveyed rock exposures a long the road, pipeline and in the well pad area.

SURVEY RESULTS: Invertebrate [ ] Plant [ ] Vertebrate [ X ] Trace [ ] No Fossils Found [ ]
There is a place near the northeast corner, Stake #2 that appears to have been bulldozed out to a
small pond years ago. There are a number of small turtle shell fragments in the lag deposits there
that may have been bulldozed up. This is a low area and will receive fill.

PALEONTOLOGY SENSITIVITY: HIGH [ ] MEDIUM [ x ] LOW [ X ] (PROJECT SPECIFIC)

MITGATION RECOMMENDATIONS: NONE [ X ] OTHER [ ] (SEE BELOW)

No recommendations are being made.

There is always a chance of encountering vertebrate fossil when working in the Uinta Formation. If
significant vertebrate fossils (mammals, crocodiles, complete turtle shells, etc.) are encountered

during construction, work should stop in that area and a paleontologist contacted to evaluate the
material discovered.

EVALUATION BY PALEONTOLOGIST: Alden H. Hamblin
A.H Hamblin Paleontological Consulting, 3793 N. Minersville Highway, Cedar City, Utah 84720 (435) 867-8355

Utah State Paleontological Permit # 07-355, BLM paleontological Resources Permit # UT-S-05-02.

Utah Professional Geologist License -
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GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

SHEEP WASH FEDERAL #31-25-9-18
SECTION 25, T9S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

C-5.7' 853' FNL 2132' FEL E-0.J,'
Proposed Access B. 904.6
Road

65' Sto. J+80
8 Approx.C-5.1' Toe ofApprox. g 97p p' ggg I SlopeTop of ---

Cut Slope
SCALE: 1" = 50'
DATE: 03-23--07 a o No.16 19Drawn By L.K.

oo>

FLARE P/T PIPE RACKS

C-2.9'
I a sozg' c-2.2, C-0.8
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20 D
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E. 900.0'

8. 909.9' 1 O'
'
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C- 15. O --
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-- Total Pit Capacky

- og
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- J,¾0 . Ws.

_
PU

MUD SHED
¯ ¯ ¯

TOILET
HOPPER

POWER

RES E P/TS
--- TR S

TOOLS
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B. 910.2' 20' WIDE BENCHC-15. J Round comers /
(btm. pit) / -

' C-0.7> as Needed

to. ovoo

O 907.5 Ð. 897 2'

Dev. Ungraded Ground at Location Stake = 4905.7
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINGBev. Graded Ground at Location Stoke = 4904.9 ,, s, zoo ,,,, . v,,.... ut., esore . reo,)
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GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
TYPICALCROSS SECTIONS FOR

×-section SHEEP WASH FEDERAL #31-25-9-18 No.16131scole
SECTION 25, T9S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

1" = So' 853' FNL 2132' FEL
i

DATE: 03-23-07
Drawn By· L.K. OF

Preconstruction 65' 150°
Grade '

CUT E/LL

STA J+80

10' 100' 45• 150'

LOCAT/ON STAKE

1O' 100' 45' 150'
Slope=
1 1/2: 1

45' 150'
I I i

Finished Grade

NOTE: / L
Topsoil should not be
Stripped Below Finished STA 0+00Grode on Substructure Area.

* NO TE
FILL QUANT/TY /NCLUDES

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES 5% FOR COMPACT/0N

CUT
EXCESS MATERIAL = 4,010 Cu. Yds.

(6") Topsoil Stripping = 2,040 Cu. Yds.
Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 4,010 Cu. Yds.

Remaining Location = 8, 150 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)

EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.
TOTAL CUT = 10,190 CU.YDS. (After Interim Rehabilitation)

FILL = 6,180 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. ß00 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (801)
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IR)RKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 10/24/2007 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-39729

WELL NAME: SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18

OPERATOR: GASCO PRODUCTION ( N2575 ) PHONE NUMBER: 303-857-9999

CONTACT: VENESSA LANGMACHER

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

NWNE 25 090S 180E .Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 0853 FNL 2132 FEL

BOTTOM: 0853 FNL 2132 FEL Engineering

COUNTY: UINTAH
Geology

LATITUDE: 40.00687 LONGITUDE: -109.8394

UTM SURF EASTINGS:599059 NORTHINGS: 4428955 Surface

FIELD NAME: 8 MILE FLAT NORTH ( 590 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-009803 PROPOSED FORMATION: BLKHK

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3.

Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] .Unit:
No. UT-1233 )

Potash (Y/N)
v//R649-3-2.

General

I Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

/' Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 43-1721 )
L RDCC Review (Y/N)

Drilling Unit

Board Cause No:
(Date: ) Eff Date:

AlÑ Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

A Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS: ggro's
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State m Utah -

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR
Division of Oil Gas and Mining

Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

October 31, 2007

Gasco Production Company
8 Inverness Drive East, Ste. 100
Englewood, CO 80112

Re: Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18 Well, 853' FNL, 2132' FEL, NW NE, Sec. 25,
T. 9 South, R. 18 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann§40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-39729.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal Office

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utaltgov OIL, GAS &

State m Utah -

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR
Division of Oil Gas and Mining

Governor JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

October 31, 2007

Gasco Production Company
8 Inverness Drive East, Ste. 100
Englewood, CO 80112

Re: Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18 Well, 853' FNL, 2132' FEL, NW NE, Sec. 25,
T. 9 South, R. 18 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann§40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-39729.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal Office

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utaltgov OIL, GAS &



Operator: Gasco Production Company

Well Name & Number Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18

API Number: 43-047-39729
Lease: UTU-009803

Location: NW NE Sec._2_5_ T. 9 South R. 18 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.

• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281 office (801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the
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Form 3160-3' FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Lease Serial No.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT SUREAU0 LANDMGMT.UTU-009803
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe NameAPPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER N/A

la. Type of Work: DRILL Q REENTER 7 If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.

b. Type of Well: On Wel Gas Wel Other Single Zone Multiple Zone Sheep Wash Federal#31-25-9-18
2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044 8 Inverness DriveEast, Suite100 9. API Well No.

GascoProduction Company Englewood,CO80112 Ñ$ ]>
3 Name of Agent 303-857-9999 14421CountyRoad10 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

Permitco Inc. - Agent Fort Lupton,CO80621 Riverbend
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area

At surface 853' FNLand2132'FEL Section25,T9S-R18E
At proposed prod. zone NWNE
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately23.96miles southeastofMyton,UT Uintah UT
li. Ötstancekomproposed' 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit < edicated to this welllocanon to nearest

perty or lease lge Appf0x.853'o to nearest drig. unit line, if any) 1400.01 40 Acres; NWNE
18. Distancetromproposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on fileto nearest well, drilling, completed,

applied for, on this lease, ft. Appf0x.1100' 12,975' Bond#UT-1233

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4906' GL ASAP 35 Days
24. Attachments CONRDENTIAL-TIGHTH0l..E

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file(see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above)

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized office.

25. Š ature Name (Printed/Typed) ' Date

Title
Û¾A y if Venessa Langmacher 7/12/2007

AuthorizedAgentfor GascoProduction Company
Approved by (Signature) Name (Printea?Typed) Date

Title niFieldManager loffice
&Minera

· WÑl¾LRELDOFFICE
Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to

cond toper thereonany.areattachedCONDITIONSOF APPROVALATTACHED
Title 18 US C. Section 1001and Title 43 USC Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

RECfWEU*(Instructions on reverse)

NORCEOFAPPROVAL NOV89 2007
DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

ò1 PÑJ 3/
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N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.

b. Type of Well: On Wel Gas Wel Other Single Zone Multiple Zone Sheep Wash Federal#31-25-9-18
2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044 8 Inverness DriveEast, Suite100 9. API Well No.

GascoProduction Company Englewood,CO80112 Ñ$ ]>
3 Name of Agent 303-857-9999 14421CountyRoad10 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

Permitco Inc. - Agent Fort Lupton,CO80621 Riverbend
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area

At surface 853' FNLand2132'FEL Section25,T9S-R18E
At proposed prod. zone NWNE
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately23.96miles southeastofMyton,UT Uintah UT
li. Ötstancekomproposed' 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit < edicated to this welllocanon to nearest

perty or lease lge Appf0x.853'o to nearest drig. unit line, if any) 1400.01 40 Acres; NWNE
18. Distancetromproposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file

to nearest well, drilling, completed,
applied for, on this lease, ft. Appf0x.1100' 12,975' Bond#UT-1233

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4906' GL ASAP 35 Days
24. Attachments CONRDENTIAL-TIGHTH0l..E

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file(see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above)

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized office.

25. Š ature Name (Printed/Typed) ' Date

Title
Û¾A y if Venessa Langmacher 7/12/2007

AuthorizedAgentfor GascoProduction Company
Approved by (Signature) Name (Printea?Typed) Date

Title niFieldManager loffice
&Minera

· WÑl¾LRELDOFFICE
Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to

cond toper thereonany.areattachedCONDITIONSOF APPROVALATTACHED
Title 18 US C. Section 1001and Title 43 USC Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
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UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMTT TO DRILL

Company: Gasco Production Co. Location: NWNE, Sec 25, T9S, R18E
Well No: Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18 Lease No: UTU-09803
API No: 43-047-39729 Agreement: N/A

Title Name Office Phone Number Cell Phone Number
Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker (435) 781-4490 (435) 828-4470
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee (435) 781-4432 (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer: James Ashley (435) 781-4470 (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer: Ryan Angus (435) 781-4430 (435) 828-7368
Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger (435) 781-4502 (435) 828-3913
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Paul Buhler (435) 781-4475 (435) 828-4029
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Karl Wright (435) 781-4484
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Holly Villa (435) 781-4404
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Chuck MacDonald (435) 781-4441 (435) 828-7481
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Jannice Cutler (435) 781-3400
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Michael Cutler (435) 781-3401
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Anna Figueroa (435) 781-3407
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Verlyn Pindell (435) 781-3402
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Darren Williams (435) 781-4447
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Nathan Packer (435) 781-3405

Fax: (435) 781-3420
A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR

FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE
All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with the
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill including
Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion
operations. This permit is approved for a two (2) year period, or until lease expiration, whichever occurs
first. An additional extension, up to two (2) years, may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and
(Notify Environmental Scientist) access roads.
Location Completion - Prior to moving on the drilling rig.
(Notify Environmental Scientist)
Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notif Petroleum Engineer)
Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and cementing
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.) all casing strings.
BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.)
First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify Petroleum Engineer) production resumes after well has been off production for more

than ninety (90)
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COAs: Page 2 of 8
Well: Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

General Surface COA

• If there is an active Gilsonite mining operation within 2 miles of the well location, operator shall
notify the Gilsonite operator at least 48 hours prior to any blasting during construction.

• If paleontological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately
stop work and contact the Authorized Officer (AO). A report will be prepared by a BLM
permitted paleontologist and submitted to the AO at the completion of surface disturbing
activities.

Site Specifics COAs:

Surface Conditions of Approval or monitoring are listed in the Surface Use Plan of the APD.

• A timing restriction on construction and drilling (including completion) from April 1 - August
31, is in order to protect nesting burrowing owls. If the operator wishes to construct from April
1 to August 31 a qualified biologist may conduct a burrowing owl survey. If no birds are present
at the time of survey, Gasco may begin construction.

• A timing restriction on construction and drilling (including completion) from May 15 - June 15,
is in order to protect nesting mountain plovers. If the operator wishes to construct from May 15
to June 15 a qualified biologist may conduct a mountain plover survey. If no birds are present at
the time of survey, Gasco may begin construction.

• Within 90 calendar days of the approval date for this Application for Permit to Drill (APD), the
operator/lessee shall submit to the Authorized Officer (AO), on Sundry Notice Form 3160-5, an
Interim Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on well pads, access roads, and
pipelines. At a minimum, this will include the reshaping of the pad to the original contour to the
extent possible; the re-re-spreading of the top soil up to the rig anchor points and the area
reseeded using appropriate reclamation methods. The AO will provide written approval or
concurrence within 30 calendar days of receipt. The following seed mix shall be used:

Type lbs.lacre
Western Wheatgrass Agropyron smithii 4
Needle and Threadgrass Stipa comata 4
Hy-crest Crested Agropyron cristatum 4
wheatgrass
** Seed should be drilled; but if broadcasted double the pounds per
acre used and work the solids mechanically to cover the
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Well: Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18

• Following well plugging and abandonment, the location, access roads, pipelines, and other
facilities shall be reclaimed. All disturbed surfaces shall be reshaped to approximate the original
contour; the top soil re-spread over the surface; and, the surface revegetated. The surface of
approved staging areas where construction activities did not occur may require disking or
ripping and reseeding. The following seed mix shall be used, unless BLM personnel determine
that conditions have changed and another mix would be more suitable:

Type lbs.lacre
Shadscale Atriplex confertifolia 3
Winterfàt Eurotia lanata 3
Galleta grass Hilaria jamesil 3
Indian Rice Grass Oryzopsis hymenoides 3
** Seed should be drilled; but if broadcasted double the pounds per
acre used and work the solids mechanically to cover the seed.

• Other reclamation methods including but not limited to mulching or soil treatments may be
required on a site-specific
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DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL:

• A surface casing shoe integrity test shall be performed.

• Production casing cement top shall be at a minimum of 200' above the surface casing shoe.

• A Cement Bond Log (CBL) shall be run from TD to the base of the surface casing.

• The commingling approval can be rescinded at any time the Authorized Officer determines the
commingling to be detrimental to the interest of the United States.

All provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

DRILLINGICOMPLETION/PRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

• The spud date and time shall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding.

• Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least 24 hours in
advance of casing cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure tests.

• Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use until the well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times.
Choke manifolds shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

• All BOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the
daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil & Gas
Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be
performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and by the rig pumps. Test shall be
reported in the driller's log.

• BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from
under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

• Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and
cemented in place.

• No aggressive/fresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

• Cement baskets shall not be run on surface
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• The operator must report all shows of water or water-bearing sands to the BLM. If flowing
water is encountered it must be sampled, analyzed, and a copy of the analyses submitted to the
BLM Vernal Field Office.

• The operator must report encounters of all non oil & gas mineral resources (such as Gilsonite, tar
sands, oil shale, trona, etc.) to the Vernal Field Office, in writing, within 5 working days of each
encounter. Each report shall include the well name/number, well location, date and depth (from
KB or GL) of encounter, vertical footage of the encounter and, the name of the person making
the report (along with a telephone number) should the BLM need to obtain additional
information.

• A complete set of angular deviation and directional surveys of a directional well will be
submitted to the Vernal BLM office engineer within 30 days of the completion of the well.

• While actively drilling, chronologic drilling progress reports shall be filed directly with the
BLM, Vernal Field Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum
Engineers until the well is completed.

• A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the top of cement and
shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of
the CBL to this office.

• Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

• There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Any changes in operation
must have prior approval from the BLM Vernal Field
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OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

• All wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

• In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "Monthly Report of
Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which
operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and
abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management
Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-
3650 for reporting information.

• Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLM Vernal Field office must be
notified when it is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be by written
communication and must be received in this office by not later than the fifth business day
following the date on which the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a
minimum, the following informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephone number.

o Well name and number.

o Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royalty will
be paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise the
non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.

• All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will
be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A, shall be
reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than
Major Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on
the Monthly Report of Operations and
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• Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days
after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys or
data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be
filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well completion report a geologic report including,
at a minimum, formation tops, and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys,
sample descriptions, strip logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if
performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the
BLM, Vernal Field Office.

• All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease, shall have
prior written approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.

• Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The BLM Vernal Field
Office Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be
submitted to the BLM Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the API
standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement. All
measurement points shall be identified as the point of sale or allocation for royalty purposes.

• A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted
to the BLM Vernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever
occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively
sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3.

• Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filing of
a suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office. Emergency approval
may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

• No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30
days, prior approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office shall be obtained and notification given
before resumption of operations.

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but no
later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not been
approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-day period will be considered as an Incident of
Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this

COAs: Page 7 of 8
Well: Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18
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produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but no
later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not been
approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-day period will be considered as an Incident of
Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this
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Well: Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18

• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or
abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent
Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual
plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of
casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING I ill | ¡ 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER
UTU-009803

SUNDRYNOTICESAND REPORTS ONWELLS 6. I NDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME
Do not use thisform for proposalstodrillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwe!Is below currentbottom4tole depth, reenterplugged walls,or to NAdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8: WELL NAMEand NUMBER
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER

Gasco Production Company 4304739729
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, ORWit.DCAT:
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 crry Englewood STATE ÛO y,, 80112 (303) 483-0044 Riverbend

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 853' FNL &2132' FEL COUNTY Uintah

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,MERIDIAN: NWNE 25 9S 18E svAm
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit OriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofworkcomplettorr

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Extend Permit
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinentdelails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company would like to request a one year extension on this APD from the date it is due to expire
(10/31/2008)

Approvedby the
UtahDivisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

initiale: g

EP Ss Ber Producdon Clerk

(This space for State use only)

RECOVED

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

Div.OEOlt,GAS&
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RESET

Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API:
Well Name: Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18

Location: NW NE Section of 25-T9S-R18E

Company Permit Issued to: Gasco Production Company
Date Original Permit Issued: 10/31/2007

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drillon the property as permitted
above, hereby verifiesthat the information as submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill, remains validand does not require revision.

Following is a checklistof some items related to the application, whichshould be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, ifso, has the surface
agreement been updated7 YesONolZI

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO Nom

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of thisproposed well? YesO NolZI

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, whichcould affect the proposed location? YesO No IZI

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged? YesO NoO

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesONolZI

Is bonding still in place, which covers thisproposed well? YeslZINoO

Sig 'a
10/27/2008

Title: Production Clerk

Representing: Gasco Production Company

RECBVED
OCT29 2008

RESET

Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API:
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Representing: Gasco Production Company

RECBVED
OCT29 2008



CONRDENRe
Fonn3160-s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-009803

Do not use this form for proposals to citfIlor to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well N/A

Oil well Gas well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18

Gasco Production Company 9. API Wel1No.

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 43-047-39729
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M., or Survey Description) Wildcat
853' FNL & 2132' FEL ii. countyor Parish, State

NW NE of Sec 25-T9S-Rl8E Uintah County, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPOLT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Spud Sundry

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(cleady state all pertinent details,includingestimated staiting dateof any proposed work and approximate durationthereof
If the pioposalis to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinot marketsand zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval,a Form 3160-4shall be filedonce
testinghas been completed. FinalAbandonmentNotices shallbe filed only aft« all reluirements, includingreclamation, have bem completed, and the operatorhas
determinedthat the site isready forfinalinspection.

This well was spud 12/3/2008 at 10:00 AM.

RECEIVED
DECO8 2008

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed! Typed)

Title
Jessica Berg Production Clerk

Signatur Date
December 5, 2008

HIS S E FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant oi
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to thoserights in the subject least Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page
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(Instructions on page



12/05/2008 16:48 GABCO ENERGY INC 3034830011 #683 Fage 02/02

STATEOF UTAN Fonu eDEPARTMENTOFIWFURALRESOURCES
DMSION OF OILGASANDMINING

ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator: Gasco PmducionCo OperalorAccountNumber N 2575
Address: 8 invemess DriveEast, Sto 100

EngleWood

mateCo sp 80112 Phone Number:

welli
API Number Wei Name QQ See Twp Rag County
4304739729 Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18 NWNE 25 OS 18E Uintah

Action Gode Current Enlity Newlingly Spud Date EntityAssignment
Number Number EmmenvoDato

M Number WeltName . GG See Twp Rng cosmty

ActionCode Current Enmy NewEndly Spud Dale . EAUlyAssigninent
Number Number EgedWo Dag

Comments:

API Number Wei Name O Bee p Rug County

Aeson cosa comentEngly NewEngly apudD EndlyAssignment
Number Number Elbague Da¾

Comments:

ACTioN CODES:
A - Estabilah newentityfor newwell(singlewellonly)
B • Addnew welltoexisling enity (gioupor unit well) se pdney
C - Re-assign wellfromone existingentityto anotherexising entty Ê A
D • Ro.essign well from one existing enity lo a new entmy
E - Other (Explainin 'comments'sectlan) on Clerk 2/5/2008

Title Date

=... RECE! ED
DECO8 2008

DÏVOFOILGAS&
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CONFIDENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy aw- Meae

RKB 25.6" AFE#70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 12/29/2008 5
Current: Operations: WAITINGON CEMENT
Depth: 3525' Prog: 0' D Hrs: 0.0 ROP #DIVIO! Formation: UINTAH
DMC: $2,087 TMC: $5,947 TDC $110,394 CUM Cost $486,589
Contractor: NABORS O9 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8 5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 27 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 1/1 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Z20 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: MOVING $ 25,200
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: GPM : SIN: U206 Float Equp: $ 3,550 Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: 3/22 1/20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 400
Solids: .5 AV DC: Depth out: 3525 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: AVDP: Depthin: 145 Packers: $ - CasingCrew: $ 12,330
PH: 8.1 JetVel: FTG: 3380 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $ -

PflMf: .00/1.45 ECD: Hrs: 70.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ 46,927
Chlor: 13500 SPR #1 : FPH: 48.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #1 $ 15,000
Ca: 480 SPR #2 : WOB: 46 $ - Mud Motors : $ -

DAPILCM - Btms. Up: 28.6 R-RPM: 40 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400
Tinse Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $ 2,087

START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1 Total Rot. irs: 70.5 Daily Total: $ 3,550 Misc. I Labor: $
6:00 8:00 2.0 T.o.O.H. shaker screens: $
8:00 9:30 1.5 L/D3 - 8" D.C.'S, 2 -12 1/8" IBS'S, TELEDRIFT,SHOCK SUB, MUDMOTOR & BIT Welding: : $
9:30 10:00 0.5 SAFETY MEETINGWITHCASERS

10:00 12:00 2.0 RIG UP CASING CREW Daily Total: $ 106,844
12:00 20:30 8.5 RUN SURFACE CASING; 31jts 8 5/8" J-55 32#, 1 -X-O, 59jts 9 5/8" P-110 47# BHA

20;30 21:30 1.0 LAND CASING RIG UP CIRC. SWEDGE - BREAKCIRC. RIG DOWN CASERS 6 1/4" D.C. f5 463.56
21:30 22:00 0.5 CIRC. THROUGH CASING WHILE SPOTTING INSCHLUMBURGER CEMENT TRUCKS

22:00 22:30 0.5 SAFETY MEETINGWITH CEMENTERS

22:30 23:30 1.0 RIG UP CEMENTERS

23:30 2:00 2.5 CEMENT WITHSCHLUMBERGER - LEAD 367bbis 530sks 11ppg - TAIL76bbis 265sks 14.2ppg

DISP. WITH H2O - BUMPED PLUG WITH223bbisFROM TANKS - HADGOOD RETURNS FOR FUL-

CEMENT JOB - CHECK FLOATS - FLOATS HELD - GOT 130bbis CEMENT BACKTO SURFACE

2:00 3:00 1 0 WATCH CEMENT INCONDUCTOR - FELLAPROX 30' BELOW GROUND LEVEL-WILL TOP OUT

WITHSACK CEMENT - RIG DOWN CEMENTERS

3:00 6:00 3.0 WAtT ON CEMENT - NIPPLE DOWN CONDUCTOR & FLOW LINE - PREP WELLHEAD-WlLL

CUT OFF CASING @08:00HRS

Total Hours 24

Depth Feet To Go Surmyside 12245' 8720' um,or L o a Ulka
Wasatch 5420' 1895' Kenilworth 12460" 8935'
Mesaverde 9250' 5725' Aberdeen 12570' 9045'
Lower Measverd 10890' 7365' Spring canyt 12695' 9170'
Castiegate 11760' 8235° Kancos 12820' 9295' TOTAL BHA = 46iÑ
Desert 12020' 8495' MN-21 13180' 9655' Survey 3,000

CONFIDENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy aw- Meae

RKB 25.6" AFE#70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 12/29/2008 5
Current: Operations: WAITINGON CEMENT
Depth: 3525' Prog: 0' D Hrs: 0.0 ROP #DIVIO! Formation: UINTAH
DMC: $2,087 TMC: $5,947 TDC $110,394 CUM Cost $486,589
Contractor: NABORS O9 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8 5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 27 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 1/1 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Z20 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: MOVING $ 25,200
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: GPM : SIN: U206 Float Equp: $ 3,550 Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: 3/22 1/20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 400

Solids: .5 AV DC: Depth out: 3525 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: AVDP: Depthin: 145 Packers: $ - CasingCrew: $ 12,330
PH: 8.1 JetVel: FTG: 3380 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $ -

PflMf: .00/1.45 ECD: Hrs: 70.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ 46,927
Chlor: 13500 SPR #1 : FPH: 48.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #1 $ 15,000
Ca: 480 SPR #2 : WOB: 46 $ - Mud Motors : $ -

DAPILCM - Btms. Up: 28.6 R-RPM: 40 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400
Tinse Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $ 2,087

START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1 Total Rot. irs: 70.5 Daily Total: $ 3,550 Misc. I Labor: $
6:00 8:00 2.0 T.o.O.H. shaker screens: $
8:00 9:30 1.5 L/D3 - 8" D.C.'S, 2 -12 1/8" IBS'S, TELEDRIFT,SHOCK SUB, MUDMOTOR & BIT Welding: : $
9:30 10:00 0.5 SAFETY MEETINGWITHCASERS

10:00 12:00 2.0 RIG UP CASING CREW Daily Total: $ 106,844

12:00 20:30 8.5 RUN SURFACE CASING; 31jts 8 5/8" J-55 32#, 1 -X-O, 59jts 9 5/8" P-110 47# BHA

20;30 21:30 1.0 LAND CASING RIG UP CIRC. SWEDGE - BREAKCIRC. RIG DOWN CASERS 6 1/4" D.C. f5 463.56
21:30 22:00 0.5 CIRC. THROUGH CASING WHILE SPOTTING INSCHLUMBURGER CEMENT TRUCKS

22:00 22:30 0.5 SAFETY MEETINGWITH CEMENTERS

22:30 23:30 1.0 RIG UP CEMENTERS

23:30 2:00 2.5 CEMENT WITHSCHLUMBERGER - LEAD 367bbis 530sks 11ppg - TAIL76bbis 265sks 14.2ppg

DISP. WITH H2O - BUMPED PLUG WITH223bbisFROM TANKS - HADGOOD RETURNS FOR FUL-

CEMENT JOB - CHECK FLOATS - FLOATS HELD - GOT 130bbis CEMENT BACKTO SURFACE

2:00 3:00 1 0 WATCH CEMENT INCONDUCTOR - FELLAPROX 30' BELOW GROUND LEVEL-WILL TOP OUT

WITHSACK CEMENT - RIG DOWN CEMENTERS

3:00 6:00 3.0 WAtT ON CEMENT - NIPPLE DOWN CONDUCTOR & FLOW LINE - PREP WELLHEAD-WlLL

CUT OFF CASING @08:00HRS

Total Hours 24

Depth Feet To Go Surmyside 12245' 8720' um,or L o a Ulka
Wasatch 5420' 1895' Kenilworth 12460" 8935'
Mesaverde 9250' 5725' Aberdeen 12570' 9045'
Lower Measverd 10890' 7365' Spring canyt 12695' 9170'
Castiegate 11760' 8235° Kancos 12820' 9295' TOTAL BHA = 46iÑ
Desert 12020' 8495' MN-21 13180' 9655' Survey 3,000



CONFilENRGASCO GASCO ENERGY yay.s 4/gg se
Ener DAILYDRILLING REPORT > g-d4'f- 3¶ g7

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: ate: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 12/30/2008 6
Current: Operations: P ŠŠURE TE$T lÒB.Ò.P.E.
Depth: 3525' Prog: 0' D Hrs: 0.0 ROP #DIVIO! Formation: UINTAH
DMC: $0 TMC: $5,947 TDC $50,268 CUM Cost $790,518
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 27 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Z20 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: MOVING $ 25,200
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: GPM : SIN: U206 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 617

Cake: Press: Jets: 3/22 1/20 Well Head: $ 2,455 Water: $ 800
Solids: .5 AVDC: Depthout: 3525 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: AV DP: Depth in: 145 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 8.1 JetVel: FTG: 3380 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/1.45 ECD: Hrs: 70.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 13500 SPR #1 : FPH: 48.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #1 $
Ca: 480 SPR #2 : WOB: 46 $ - Mud Motors : $ 14,695
DAPILCM - Btms. Up: 28.6 R-RPM: 40 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Time Break Dow i: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $
START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1 Total Rot. drs: 70.5 Daily Total: $ 2,455 Misc. I Labor: $ 488

6:00 8:00 2.0 WAITON CEMENT shaker screens: $
8:00 13:00 5.0 CUT OFF CONDUCTOR AND CASING - WELD ON WELLHEAD- PSI TEST WELLHEADTO 1500pf Welding: : $ 1,113
13:00 0:00 11.0 NIPPLE UP B.O.P.E. & FUNCTIONTEST

0:00 6:00 6.0 TEST B.O.P.E. - 250psi LOW 5000psi HIGH = LWC, FLLOR &DARTVALVE,UPPER & LOWER PIE Daily Total: $ 47,813
BLLIND RAMS, HCR, ALL MANUAL VALVES,CHOKE MANIFOLD; 250psi LOW 5000psi HIGHANN BHA

SURFACE CASING 1500psi- 30MIN 6 1/4" D.C. 15 463.56

HECEIVED

Total Hours 24
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' 8720'

Wasatch 5420' 1895' Kenilworth 12460' 8935'
Mesaverde 9250' 5725' Aberdeen 12570' 9045'
Lower Measverd 10890' 7365' Spring canyt 12695' 9170'
Castlegate 11760' 8235' Mancos 12820' 9295' TOTAL BHA = 463.56
Desert 12020' 8495' MN-21 13180' 9655' Survey 3,000

CONFilENRGASCO GASCO ENERGY yay.s 4/gg se
Ener DAILYDRILLING REPORT > g-d4'f- 3¶ g7

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: ate: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 12/30/2008 6

Current: Operations: P ŠŠURE TE$T lÒB.Ò.P.E.
Depth: 3525' Prog: 0' D Hrs: 0.0 ROP #DIVIO! Formation: UINTAH
DMC: $0 TMC: $5,947 TDC $50,268 CUM Cost $790,518
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 27 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Z20 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: MOVING $ 25,200
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: GPM : SIN: U206 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 617

Cake: Press: Jets: 3/22 1/20 Well Head: $ 2,455 Water: $ 800

Solids: .5 AVDC: Depthout: 3525 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: AV DP: Depth in: 145 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 8.1 JetVel: FTG: 3380 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/1.45 ECD: Hrs: 70.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 13500 SPR #1 : FPH: 48.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #1 $
Ca: 480 SPR #2 : WOB: 46 $ - Mud Motors : $ 14,695
DAPILCM - Btms. Up: 28.6 R-RPM: 40 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Time Break Dow i: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $
START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1 Total Rot. drs: 70.5 Daily Total: $ 2,455 Misc. I Labor: $ 488

6:00 8:00 2.0 WAITON CEMENT shaker screens: $
8:00 13:00 5.0 CUT OFF CONDUCTOR AND CASING - WELD ON WELLHEAD- PSI TEST WELLHEADTO 1500pf Welding: : $ 1,113

13:00 0:00 11.0 NIPPLE UP B.O.P.E. & FUNCTIONTEST

0:00 6:00 6.0 TEST B.O.P.E. - 250psi LOW 5000psi HIGH = LWC, FLLOR &DARTVALVE,UPPER & LOWER PIE Daily Total: $ 47,813

BLLIND RAMS, HCR, ALL MANUAL VALVES,CHOKE MANIFOLD; 250psi LOW 5000psi HIGHANN BHA

SURFACE CASING 1500psi- 30MIN 6 1/4" D.C. 15 463.56

HECEIVED

Total Hours 24

Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' 8720'
Wasatch 5420' 1895' Kenilworth 12460' 8935'
Mesaverde 9250' 5725' Aberdeen 12570' 9045'
Lower Measverd 10890' 7365' Spring canyt 12695' 9170'
Castlegate 11760' 8235' Mancos 12820' 9295' TOTAL BHA = 463.56
Desert 12020' 8495' MN-21 13180' 9655' Survey 3,000



CONFllENTIALGASCO GASCOENERGY og, y¡gg
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT t/2-d97-3¶/Mg

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 12/31/2008 7

Current: Operations: DRLGAHEAD @4614'
Depth: 4614' Prog: 1089' D Hrs: 12.5 ROP 87.1 Formation: UINTAH
DMC: $1,820 TMC: $7,767 TDC $32,320 CUM Cost $822,838
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 27 SPM: 65 Size: 12 1/4 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 1/1 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: Z20 MS1657 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: MOVING $ 25,200
Gel: SPM: 65 MFG: ULTERRA UTLTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: GPM : 450 SIN: U206 6370 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 900 Jets: 3/22 1/20 7 x 15's Well Head: $ - Water: $ 400

Solids: .5 AV DC: 355 Depth out: 3525 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: AV DP: 197 Depth in: 145 3525 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.5 JetVel: 112 FTG: 3380 1089 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/2.40 ECD: 8.62 Hrs: 70.5 12.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 14300 SPR #1 : FPH: 48.0 87.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #1 $
Ca: 268 SPR #2 : WOB: 46 20 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM - Btms. Up: 17.6 R-RPM: 40 60 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Tirre Break Dow i: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 70 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $ 1,820

START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1 Total Rot. irs: 83.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $
6:00 7:00 1.0 FINISHWITHCASING TEST - RIG DOWN TESTER shaker screens: $
7:00 11:00 4.0 NIPPLE UP FLOW LINE - CHANGE OUT FLOW LINE SENSORS - CHANGE SWlVEL PACKING Welding: : $
11:00 15:30 4.5 P/U BIT,MOTOR,TELEDRIFT, IBS'S, &3 6 1/4" D.C.'S - T.I.H.- TAG CEMENT @3460'

15:30 17:00 1.5 DRILLCEMENT& FLOATEQUIPMENT - DRILL15' NEW HOLE Daily Total: $ 32,320

17:00 17:30 0.5 FIT - 550psi FOR 15 MIN= EQUIV.TO 11.5ppg MUD - HELDOK BHA

17:30 6:00 12.5 DRLGFR3540'-4614' @ 8T/HR-TELEDRIFTSURVEYS2* BIT 1 1.00
.16 STAB MOTOF 1 35.49
TELEDRIFT 1 8.50
IBS 1 5.96

RECEIVED °s's/4"D.C. 1 3105

DEC3 I 2008 6 1/4" D.C. 17 525.01

DIV.OFDIL,GM î MlNING

Total Hours 24.0
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' 7631'

Wasatch 5420' 806' Kenilworth 12460' 7846'

Mesaverde 9250' 4636' Aberdeen 12570' 7956'

Lower Measverd 10890' 6276' Spring cany. 12695' 8081'
Castlegate 11760' 7146' Mancos 12820' 8206' TOTAL BHA = 611.59

Desert 12020' 7406' MN-21 13180' 8566' Survey 4,092

CONFllENTIALGASCO GASCOENERGY og, y¡gg
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT t/2-d97-3¶/Mg

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 12/31/2008 7

Current: Operations: DRLGAHEAD @4614'
Depth: 4614' Prog: 1089' D Hrs: 12.5 ROP 87.1 Formation: UINTAH
DMC: $1,820 TMC: $7,767 TDC $32,320 CUM Cost $822,838
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 27 SPM: 65 Size: 12 1/4 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 1/1 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: Z20 MS1657 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: MOVING $ 25,200
Gel: SPM: 65 MFG: ULTERRA UTLTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: GPM : 450 SIN: U206 6370 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 900 Jets: 3/22 1/20 7 x 15's Well Head: $ - Water: $ 400

Solids: .5 AV DC: 355 Depth out: 3525 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: AV DP: 197 Depth in: 145 3525 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.5 JetVel: 112 FTG: 3380 1089 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/2.40 ECD: 8.62 Hrs: 70.5 12.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 14300 SPR #1 : FPH: 48.0 87.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #1 $
Ca: 268 SPR #2 : WOB: 46 20 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM - Btms. Up: 17.6 R-RPM: 40 60 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Tirre Break Dow i: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 70 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $ 1,820

START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1 Total Rot. irs: 83.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $
6:00 7:00 1.0 FINISHWITHCASING TEST - RIG DOWN TESTER shaker screens: $
7:00 11:00 4.0 NIPPLE UP FLOW LINE - CHANGE OUT FLOW LINE SENSORS - CHANGE SWlVEL PACKING Welding: : $
11:00 15:30 4.5 P/U BIT,MOTOR,TELEDRIFT, IBS'S, &3 6 1/4" D.C.'S - T.I.H.- TAG CEMENT @3460'

15:30 17:00 1.5 DRILLCEMENT& FLOATEQUIPMENT - DRILL15' NEW HOLE Daily Total: $ 32,320

17:00 17:30 0.5 FIT - 550psi FOR 15 MIN= EQUIV.TO 11.5ppg MUD - HELDOK BHA

17:30 6:00 12.5 DRLGFR3540'-4614' @ 8T/HR-TELEDRIFTSURVEYS2* BIT 1 1.00

.16 STAB MOTOF 1 35.49
TELEDRIFT 1 8.50

IBS 1 5.96

RECEIVED °s's/4"D.C. 1 3105

DEC3 I 2008
6 1/4" D.C. 17 525.01

DIV.OFDIL,GM î MlNING

Total Hours 24.0

Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' 7631'
Wasatch 5420' 806' Kenilworth 12460' 7846'

Mesaverde 9250' 4636' Aberdeen 12570' 7956'

Lower Measverd 10890' 6276' Spring cany. 12695' 8081'
Castlegate 11760' 7146' Mancos 12820' 8206' TOTAL BHA = 611.59

Desert 12020' 7406' MN-21 13180' 8566' Survey 4,092



GASCO ENERGYGASCOÔ DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy W w 'eme
RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/5/2009 12

Current: Operations: DRLÓAHEAD @9704'
Depth: 9704' Prog: 349' D Hrs: 11.0 ROP 31.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $9,282 TMC: $45,321 TDC $41,557 CUM Cost $1,037,451
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 3 -4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 41 SPM: 55 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 17/10 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MI616 MS 1666D Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 25,200
Gel: 2/3 SPM: 55 MFG: SMITH ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: 7.6 GPM : 384 SIN: JY5876 5339 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1150 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ 800

Solids: 6 AV DC: 320 Depth out: 9370 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 10 AV DP: 194 Depth in: 8611 9370 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 8 JetVel: 103 FTG: 759 334 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $ 615

PflMf: .00/3.25 ECD: 9.35 Hrs: 29.5 9.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 13700 SPR #1 : FPH: 25.7 35.1 Heater: $ - Bit: #1 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 28-30 22 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.7 Btms. Up: 49 R-RPM: 45-60 45-50 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Time Break Dowi: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64 62 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $ 9,282

START END TIME RM36 I DR 1 Total Rot. irs: 176.5 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 760

6:00 7:30 1.5 DRLG FR 9355' - 9370' @ 10'lHR shaker screens: $
7:30 8:00 0.5 PUMP PILL - DROP SURVEY - BLOW DOWN KELLYHOSE Welding: : $
8:00 13:00 5.0 T.O.O.H. - L/D 1jt TO STAGER BREAKS FROM LASTTRIP - NO TIGHTSPOTS

13:00 13:30 0.5 BREAK BIT - MAKEUP NEW BiT Daily Total: $ 41,557

13:30 19:30 6.0 T.I.H. - BREAK CIRC. @ 5100' - INSTALLROT. HEAD BHA

19:30 20:30 1.0 WASH & REAMTO BTM - P/U JT OF D.P. BREAK INBIT -5150units TRIP GAS - 5'-15 FLARE BIT 1 1.00

20:30 6:00 9.5 DRLG FR9370'-9704' @ 35/HR .16 STAB MOTOf 1 35.50
TELEDRIFT 1 UYG
1BS 1 5.96
6 1/4" D.C. 1 31.05

RECEIVED IBS 1 4.58
6 1/4" D.C. 17 525.01

JANO5 2009

DIV.UPUIL,WAb&IVillillië

Total Hours 24.0
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245° 2541'

Wasatch 5420' -4284' Kenilworth 12460' 2756'

Mesaverde 9250' -454' Aberdeen 12570' 2866'
Lower Measverd 10890' 1186' Spring canys 12695' 2991'
Castlegate 11760" 2056' Mancos 12820' 3116° TOTAL BHA = 603.10

Desert 12020' 2316' MN-21 13180' 3476' Survey 9,350

GASCO ENERGYGASCOÔ DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy W w 'eme
RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/5/2009 12

Current: Operations: DRLÓAHEAD @9704'
Depth: 9704' Prog: 349' D Hrs: 11.0 ROP 31.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $9,282 TMC: $45,321 TDC $41,557 CUM Cost $1,037,451
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 3 -4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 41 SPM: 55 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 17/10 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MI616 MS 1666D Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 25,200

Gel: 2/3 SPM: 55 MFG: SMITH ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: 7.6 GPM : 384 SIN: JY5876 5339 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1150 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ 800

Solids: 6 AV DC: 320 Depth out: 9370 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 10 AV DP: 194 Depth in: 8611 9370 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 8 JetVel: 103 FTG: 759 334 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $ 615

PflMf: .00/3.25 ECD: 9.35 Hrs: 29.5 9.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 13700 SPR #1 : FPH: 25.7 35.1 Heater: $ - Bit: #1 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 28-30 22 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.7 Btms. Up: 49 R-RPM: 45-60 45-50 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Time Break Dowi: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64 62 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $ 9,282

START END TIME RM36 I DR 1 Total Rot. irs: 176.5 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 760

6:00 7:30 1.5 DRLG FR 9355' - 9370' @ 10'lHR shaker screens: $
7:30 8:00 0.5 PUMP PILL - DROP SURVEY - BLOW DOWN KELLYHOSE Welding: : $
8:00 13:00 5.0 T.O.O.H. - L/D 1jt TO STAGER BREAKS FROM LASTTRIP - NO TIGHTSPOTS

13:00 13:30 0.5 BREAK BIT - MAKEUP NEW BiT Daily Total: $ 41,557

13:30 19:30 6.0 T.I.H. - BREAK CIRC. @ 5100' - INSTALLROT. HEAD BHA

19:30 20:30 1.0 WASH & REAMTO BTM - P/U JT OF D.P. BREAK INBIT -5150units TRIP GAS - 5'-15 FLARE BIT 1 1.00

20:30 6:00 9.5 DRLG FR9370'-9704' @ 35/HR .16 STAB MOTOf 1 35.50
TELEDRIFT 1 UYG
1BS 1 5.96
6 1/4" D.C. 1 31.05

RECEIVED IBS 1 4.58
6 1/4" D.C. 17 525.01

JANO5 2009

DIV.UPUIL,WAb&IVillillië

Total Hours 24.0

Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245° 2541'
Wasatch 5420' -4284' Kenilworth 12460' 2756'

Mesaverde 9250' -454' Aberdeen 12570' 2866'
Lower Measverd 10890' 1186' Spring canys 12695' 2991'
Castlegate 11760" 2056' Mancos 12820' 3116° TOTAL BHA = 603.10

Desert 12020' 2316' MN-21 13180' 3476' Survey 9,350



CONFllENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY -7,µ 47 ,_4

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT L/.2- 0 W- 9'7Ä¶
RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/6/2009 13

Current: Operations: okiLUNûAHEAb g 10710'
Depth: 10710' Prog: 1006' D Hrs: 22.5 ROP 44.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $5,455 TMC: $50,776 TDC $36,355 CUM Cost $1,073,806
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.2 #1 F-1000 3.5 ppm Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 39 SPM: 55 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 18/10 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MI616 MS 1666D Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 25,200
Gel: 2/4 SPM: 55 MFG: SMITH ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: 7.4 GPM : 384 SIN: JY5876 5339 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1500 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ 800

Solids: 6 AV DC: 322 Depth out: 9370 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 11.5 AV DP: 196 Depth in: 8611 9370 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.8 JetVel: 105 FTG: 759 1340 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/3.10 ECD: 9.45 Hrs: 29.5 32.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 12900 SPR #1 : FPH: 25.7 42.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #1 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 28-30 28 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.8 Btms. Up: 50 R-RPM: 45-60 45 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Tirne Break Dow1: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64 61 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $ 5,455

START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1.5 Total Rot. irs: 199.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

6:00 12:30 6.5 DRLG FR 9704'-9956' @ 38.8'lHR shaker screens: $
12:30 13:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Welding: : $ -

13:00 16:30 3.5 DRLGFR9956'-10109' @ 43.7'/HR

16:30 17:00 0.5 DOWN TIME - GENERATOR OVERHEATED& SHUT DOWN Daily Total: $ 36,355

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRLG FR 10109' - 10148" @ 39'lHR BHA

18:00 18:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE DRAWORKS - BLOW METHONALINAIR LINES BIT 1 1.00

18:30 6:00 11.5 DRLG FR 10148'- 10710' @ 48.8'IHR - PEAK GAS 5550units - 5'-15' FLARE .16 STAB MOTOF 1 35.50
TELEDRIFT 1 UYG
IBS 1 5.96
6 1/4" D.C. 1 31.05

DECEIVED IBS 1 4.58
6 1/4" D.C. 17 525.01

JANOG2003

DIV.0F0lLGAS&MINING

Total Hours 24.0
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' 1535'

Wasatch 5420' -5290' Kenilworth 12460" 1750'
Mesaverde 9250' -1460' Aberdeen 12570' 1860°

Lower Measverd 10890' 180' Spring canys 12695' 1985'

Castiegate 11760' 1050' Mancos 12820° 2110' TOTAL BHA = 603.10

Desert 12020" 1310' MN-21 13180° 2470' Survey 9,952

CONFllENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY -7,µ 47 ,_4

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT L/.2- 0 W- 9'7Ä¶
RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/6/2009 13

Current: Operations: okiLUNûAHEAb g 10710'
Depth: 10710' Prog: 1006' D Hrs: 22.5 ROP 44.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $5,455 TMC: $50,776 TDC $36,355 CUM Cost $1,073,806
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.2 #1 F-1000 3.5 ppm Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 39 SPM: 55 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 18/10 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MI616 MS 1666D Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 25,200

Gel: 2/4 SPM: 55 MFG: SMITH ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: 7.4 GPM : 384 SIN: JY5876 5339 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1500 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ 800

Solids: 6 AV DC: 322 Depth out: 9370 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 11.5 AV DP: 196 Depth in: 8611 9370 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.8 JetVel: 105 FTG: 759 1340 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/3.10 ECD: 9.45 Hrs: 29.5 32.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 12900 SPR #1 : FPH: 25.7 42.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #1 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 28-30 28 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.8 Btms. Up: 50 R-RPM: 45-60 45 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Tirne Break Dow1: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64 61 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $ 5,455

START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1.5 Total Rot. irs: 199.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

6:00 12:30 6.5 DRLG FR 9704'-9956' @ 38.8'lHR shaker screens: $
12:30 13:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Welding: : $ -

13:00 16:30 3.5 DRLGFR9956'-10109' @ 43.7'/HR

16:30 17:00 0.5 DOWN TIME - GENERATOR OVERHEATED& SHUT DOWN Daily Total: $ 36,355

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRLG FR 10109' - 10148" @ 39'lHR BHA

18:00 18:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE DRAWORKS - BLOW METHONALINAIR LINES BIT 1 1.00

18:30 6:00 11.5 DRLG FR 10148'- 10710' @ 48.8'IHR - PEAK GAS 5550units - 5'-15' FLARE .16 STAB MOTOF 1 35.50
TELEDRIFT 1 UYG
IBS 1 5.96

6 1/4" D.C. 1 31.05

DECEIVED IBS 1 4.58

6 1/4" D.C. 17 525.01

JANOG2003

DIV.0F0lLGAS&MINING

Total Hours 24.0

Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' 1535'

Wasatch 5420' -5290' Kenilworth 12460" 1750'
Mesaverde 9250' -1460' Aberdeen 12570' 1860°

Lower Measverd 10890' 180' Spring canys 12695' 1985'

Castiegate 11760' 1050' Mancos 12820° 2110' TOTAL BHA = 603.10

Desert 12020" 1310' MN-21 13180° 2470' Survey 9,952



CONFilENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY Yoy.sd/BE
.se

DAILYDRILLING REPORT Lg--dyf 3 ÿÿEnergy
RKB 25.6" AFE#70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT109.50.392W

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:
SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/7/2009 14

Current: Operations: T.I.H. WITH BIT #5
Depth: 11044' Prog: 334' D Hrs: 10.0 ROP 33.4 Formation: LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $6,967 TMC: $57,743 TDC $188,252 CUM Cost $1,262,058
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.8 #1F-10003.5gpm Bit#: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 40 SPM: 55 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ 106,790

PVIYP: 18/10 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MS 1666D DP506ZX Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 25,200
Gel: 2/5 SPM: 55 MFG: ULTERRA HUGHES Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: 8 GPM : 384 SIN: 5339 7118009 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1660 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2.350

Solids: 8 AV DC: 322 Depth out: 11044 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 14,880
MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 196 Depth in: 9370 11044 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH: 8.1 JetVel: 105 FTG: 1674 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 9.95 Hrs: 42.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 12500 SPR #1 : FPH: 39.9 Heater: $ - Bit: #2 $ 10,500
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 30 $ - Mud Motors : $ 8,950
DAPILCM 4.9 Btms. Up: 56 R-RPM: 15-55 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 2,800

Time Break Don 1: Total D.T. M-RPM: 61 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $ 6,967
START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1.5 Total Rot. irs: 209.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,415

6:00 13:30 7.5 DRLG FR 10710' - 11007 @ 39.6'lHR shaker screens: $ 3,900
13:30 14:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Welding: : $ -

14:00 16:30 2.5 DRLG FR 1100T - 11044 @14.8'lHR - LAST8' ROP DOWN TO 7'-10'Ihr

16:30 17:00 0.5 PUMP PILL - DROP SURVEY- BLOW DOWN KELLYHOSE Daily Total: $ 188,252

17:00 22:30 5.5 T.O.O.H. FOR BIT&CHANGE BHA- PIPE COUNT MATCHEDTHATOF THE PIPE TALLY BHA

22:30 23:30 1.0 L/D IBS'S, TELEDRIFT, MOTOR& BIT- PIPE SKATE NOT WORKING BIT 1 1.00
23:30 0:30 1.0 PULL WEAR BUSHING &CHECK FOR WEAR- LITTLE WEAR - INSTALL NEW WEAR BUSHING BIT SUB 1 3.30
0:30 6:00 5.5 MAKEUP NEW BIT& BITSUB P/U TELEDRIFT - T.I.H. - FILLPIPE @4000' 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06

RECEiVED
JAN08 2003

DIVOFOIL,CASSMININC

Total Hours 24.0
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' 1201'

Wasatch 5420' -5624' Kenilworth 12460° 1416'
Mesaverde 9250' -1794' Aberdeen 12570' 1526'

Lower Measverd 10890' -154' Spring canyt 12695' 1651'
Castlegate 11760' 716' Mancos 12820' 1776' TOTAL BHA = 560.36
Desert 12020' 976' MN-21 13180' 2136• Survey 11,004

CONFilENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY Yoy.sd/BE
.se

DAILYDRILLING REPORT Lg--dyf 3 ÿÿEnergy
RKB 25.6" AFE#70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT109.50.392W

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:
SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/7/2009 14

Current: Operations: T.I.H. WITH BIT #5
Depth: 11044' Prog: 334' D Hrs: 10.0 ROP 33.4 Formation: LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $6,967 TMC: $57,743 TDC $188,252 CUM Cost $1,262,058
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.8 #1F-10003.5gpm Bit#: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 40 SPM: 55 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ 106,790

PVIYP: 18/10 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MS 1666D DP506ZX Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 25,200
Gel: 2/5 SPM: 55 MFG: ULTERRA HUGHES Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 3,500

WL: 8 GPM : 384 SIN: 5339 7118009 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1660 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2.350

Solids: 8 AV DC: 322 Depth out: 11044 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 14,880

MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 196 Depth in: 9370 11044 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH: 8.1 JetVel: 105 FTG: 1674 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 9.95 Hrs: 42.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 12500 SPR #1 : FPH: 39.9 Heater: $ - Bit: #2 $ 10,500

Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 30 $ - Mud Motors : $ 8,950
DAPILCM 4.9 Btms. Up: 56 R-RPM: 15-55 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 2,800

Time Break Don 1: Total D.T. M-RPM: 61 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $ 6,967

START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1.5 Total Rot. irs: 209.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,415

6:00 13:30 7.5 DRLG FR 10710' - 11007 @ 39.6'lHR shaker screens: $ 3,900

13:30 14:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Welding: : $ -

14:00 16:30 2.5 DRLG FR 1100T - 11044 @14.8'lHR - LAST8' ROP DOWN TO 7'-10'Ihr

16:30 17:00 0.5 PUMP PILL - DROP SURVEY- BLOW DOWN KELLYHOSE Daily Total: $ 188,252

17:00 22:30 5.5 T.O.O.H. FOR BIT&CHANGE BHA- PIPE COUNT MATCHEDTHATOF THE PIPE TALLY BHA

22:30 23:30 1.0 L/D IBS'S, TELEDRIFT, MOTOR& BIT- PIPE SKATE NOT WORKING BIT 1 1.00

23:30 0:30 1.0 PULL WEAR BUSHING &CHECK FOR WEAR- LITTLE WEAR - INSTALL NEW WEAR BUSHING BIT SUB 1 3.30

0:30 6:00 5.5 MAKEUP NEW BIT& BITSUB P/U TELEDRIFT - T.I.H. - FILLPIPE @4000' 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06

RECEiVED
JAN08 2003

DIVOFOIL,CASSMININC

Total Hours 24.0

Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' 1201'

Wasatch 5420' -5624' Kenilworth 12460° 1416'
Mesaverde 9250' -1794' Aberdeen 12570' 1526'

Lower Measverd 10890' -154' Spring canyt 12695' 1651'
Castlegate 11760' 716' Mancos 12820' 1776' TOTAL BHA = 560.36

Desert 12020' 976' MN-21 13180' 2136• Survey 11,004



CONRDENTIALGASCO ENERGY ~oy.g 4/gg seGASCO DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3 ØŸ¾ Jÿ ÛÑ¶Energy
RKB 25.6 AFE#70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT109.50.392W

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:
SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/8/2009 15

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11525' Prog: 481' D Hrs: 20 0 ROP 24.1 Formation: LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $5,757 TMC: $63,500 TDC $62,057 CUM Cost $1,324,115
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.8 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 43 SPM: 110 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ 4,200

PVlYP: 14/14 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MS 1666D DP506ZX Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 25,200
Gel: 3/7 SPM: 0 MFG: ULTERRA HUGHES Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 8 GPM : 384 SIN: 5339 7118009 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1175 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $800
Solids: 8 AV DC: 384 Depth out: 11044 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $18,750
MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 233.5 Depth in: 9370 11044 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.8 JetVel: 142 FTG: 1674 481 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/4.50 ECD: 10.15 Hrs: 42,0 20,0 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 39.9 24.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #2 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 30 20/28 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.25/0 Stms. Up: 49 R-RPM: 15-55 60/65 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 2,800

Tin e Break Dow1: Total D.T. M-RPM: 61 NA Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $5,757
START END TIME RM36/DR £5 Total Rot. Ars: 209.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc.I Labor: $

6:00 8:30 2.5 CONTINUE R!H22 STDS PER/HR shaker screens: $ 550
8:30 9:30 1.0 BREAKCIRC. & REAM&WASH F/10960' TO BOTTOM@ 11044' {BREAKIN BIT) Welding: : $
9:30 17:30 8.0 DRILLF/11044' TO 11250' ROP = 25.75 {NOTE: 15 MIN.PUMP UP WT. INDICATOR}

17:30 18:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG &TOP DRIVE Daily Total: $ 62,057
18:00 6:00 12.0 DRILLF/11250" TO 11525' ROP = 23' BHA

BIT 1 1.00
BITSUB 1 3.30
6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06

AFCFivFr)
lANO8 2009

OliOFOli.,GA3&MUNG

Total Hours 24.0
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245 720'

Wasatch 5420' 4105' Kenilworth 12460' 935'
Mesaverde 9250' -2275' Aberdeen 12570' 1045°

Lower Measverd 10890' -635' Spring canyt 12695' 1170'

Castlegate 11760" 235' lulancos 12820" 1295' TOTAL BHA = 560.36
Desert 12020' 495' MN-21 13180' 1655' Survey 11,004



CONFllENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY oÿs
Energy DAILYDRILLING REPORT L S-Q

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31•25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/9/2009 16

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11666' Prog: 141' D Hrs: 7.0 ROP 20.1 Formation: LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $7,480 TMC: $70,980 TDC $52,880 CUM Cost $1,376,995
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 41 SPM: 110 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 15/13 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: DP506ZX H506ZX+ Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 25,200
Gel: 4/9 SPM: 0 MFG: HTC HUGHES Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 8.8 GPM : 384 SIN: 7118009 7117833 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1175 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $800
Solids/L.G. 10/5.6 AV DC: 384 Depth out: 11566 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 233.5 Depth in: 11044 11566 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.7 JetVel: 142 FTG: 522 100 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/4.70 ECD: 10.15 Hrs: 24.0 3.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 21.8 33.0 Heater: $ - Bit: # 5 $ 14,000

Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 26/32 20/24 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.25/0 Btms. Up: 50 R-RPM: 55/68 60 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Time Break Dowi: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA NA Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $7,480
START END TIME RM 36 I DR t.5 Total Rot. irs: 236.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $

6:00 10:00 4.0 DRILLF/11525' TO 11566' ROP = 10.25 shaker screens: $
10:00 11:00 1.0 SLUG D.P. & DROP SURVEYTOOL Welding: : $
11:00 18:00 7.0 POOH L/DTELEDRIFTTOOL & CHECK FLOATREPLACE SAME

18:00 20:00 2.0 M/UBIT#6 & RlH TO SHOE BREAKCIRC. & FUNCTIONTEST BOP OK Daily Total: $ 52,880

20:00 21:00 1.0 SLIP &CUT DRILLINGLINE BHA

21:00 21:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE BIT 1 1.00

21:30 2:00 4.5 CONTINUE RIH BREAK CIRC. @ 8,000" & CONTINUE RIHTO 11480' BIT SUB 1 3.30

2:00 3:00 1.0 WASH & REAMF/11480' TO BOTTOM@ 11566' {NOTIGHTHOLE OR FILL} 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06

3:00 6:00 3.0 BREAK IN BIT & DRILLF/11566' TO 11666' ROP = 33'

RECOVI-D

JANO9 7004

x OFOiL,GAS&MINING

Total Hours 24.0
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' 579'

Wasatch 5420' -6246' Kenilworth 12460' 794'
Mesaverde 9250' -2416' Aberdeen 12570' 904'
Lower Measverd 10890' -776' Spring canyt 12695' 1029'

Castlegate 11760' 94' Mancos 12820' 1154' TOTAL BHA = 560.36

Desert 12020' 354' MN-21 13180' 1514' Survey 11,044

CONFllENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY oÿs
Energy DAILYDRILLING REPORT L S-Q

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31•25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/9/2009 16

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11666' Prog: 141' D Hrs: 7.0 ROP 20.1 Formation: LOWER MESAVERDE
DMC: $7,480 TMC: $70,980 TDC $52,880 CUM Cost $1,376,995
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 41 SPM: 110 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 15/13 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: DP506ZX H506ZX+ Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 25,200

Gel: 4/9 SPM: 0 MFG: HTC HUGHES Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 8.8 GPM : 384 SIN: 7118009 7117833 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1175 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $800
Solids/L.G. 10/5.6 AV DC: 384 Depth out: 11566 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 233.5 Depth in: 11044 11566 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.7 JetVel: 142 FTG: 522 100 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/4.70 ECD: 10.15 Hrs: 24.0 3.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 21.8 33.0 Heater: $ - Bit: # 5 $ 14,000

Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 26/32 20/24 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.25/0 Btms. Up: 50 R-RPM: 55/68 60 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Time Break Dowi: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA NA Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $7,480
START END TIME RM 36 I DR t.5 Total Rot. irs: 236.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $

6:00 10:00 4.0 DRILLF/11525' TO 11566' ROP = 10.25 shaker screens: $
10:00 11:00 1.0 SLUG D.P. & DROP SURVEYTOOL Welding: : $
11:00 18:00 7.0 POOH L/DTELEDRIFTTOOL & CHECK FLOATREPLACE SAME

18:00 20:00 2.0 M/UBIT#6 & RlH TO SHOE BREAKCIRC. & FUNCTIONTEST BOP OK Daily Total: $ 52,880

20:00 21:00 1.0 SLIP &CUT DRILLINGLINE BHA

21:00 21:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE BIT 1 1.00

21:30 2:00 4.5 CONTINUE RIH BREAK CIRC. @ 8,000" & CONTINUE RIHTO 11480' BIT SUB 1 3.30

2:00 3:00 1.0 WASH & REAMF/11480' TO BOTTOM@ 11566' {NOTIGHTHOLE OR FILL} 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06

3:00 6:00 3.0 BREAK IN BIT & DRILLF/11566' TO 11666' ROP = 33'

RECOVI-D

JANO9 7004

x OFOiL,GAS&MINING

Total Hours 24.0
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' 579'

Wasatch 5420' -6246' Kenilworth 12460' 794'
Mesaverde 9250' -2416' Aberdeen 12570' 904'
Lower Measverd 10890' -776' Spring canyt 12695' 1029'

Castlegate 11760' 94' Mancos 12820' 1154' TOTAL BHA = 560.36

Desert 12020' 354' MN-21 13180' 1514' Survey 11,044



CONFIDENTGASCO GASCO ENERGY 75 & MÆ
Energy DAILYORILLING REPORT L g-dg- 3¶¶

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/12/2009 19

Current: Operations: POOH FOR BIT
Depth: 12344' Prog: 233' D Hrs: 20.0 ROP 11.7 Formation: SUNNYSIDE
DMC: $5,100 TMC: $85,700 TDC $57,600 CUM Cost $1,503,715
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 6 7 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 41 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 SurF. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 13/13 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: H506ZX+ MS1666 Int. Cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 4/10 SPM: 110 MFG: HTC ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 10.4 GPM : 384 SIN: 7117833 5337 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 600

Cake: 2 Press: 1225 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $800
Solids/L.G. 11/5.9 AV DC: 325 Depth out: 11918 12344 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 197.7 Depth in: 11566 11918 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.7 JetVel: 105 FTG: 352 426 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/4.40 ECD: 10.59 Hrs; 18.5 35.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 10000 SPR #1 : FPH: 19.0 12.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #7 $ 14,000

Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 20/28 22132 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.25/0 Btms. Up: 61 R-RPM: 58/65 55/65 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Time Break Dow1: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA NA Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $5,TOO

START END TIME RM 30|DR 1.5 Total Rot. irs: 289.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc.I Labor: $ 7,700

6:00 11:30 5.5 DRILLFI12111' TO 12196' ROP = 15.45' shaker screens: $
11:30 12:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE Welding: : $
12:00 18:00 6 0 DRILL F/12196' TO 12252' ROP = 9.33'

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE TOP DRIVE Daily Total: $ 57,600

18:30 4:00 9.5 DRILLF/12252' TO 12344' ROP = 9.7 BHA

4:00 6:00 2.0 SLUG D P. & DROP SURVEY TOOL & POOH FOR BIT BIT 1 1.00
BIT SUB 1 3.30

RAtSE MUDWT. TO 10.5 PPG 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556 06

RECEIVED
JAN1 2 2003

DN.0FOLGAS

Total Hours 24.0
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' -99'

Wasatch 5420' -6924' Kenilworth 12460' 116'
Mesaverde 9250' •3094' Aberdeen 12570' 226'
Lower Measverd 10890" -1454' Spring canyt 12695' 351'
Castlegate 11760' -584' Mancos 12820' 476' TOTAL BHA = 560.36

Desert 12020' -324' MN-21 13180' 836' Survey 11,566'

CONFIDENTGASCO GASCO ENERGY 75 & MÆ
Energy DAILYORILLING REPORT L g-dg- 3¶¶

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/12/2009 19

Current: Operations: POOH FOR BIT
Depth: 12344' Prog: 233' D Hrs: 20.0 ROP 11.7 Formation: SUNNYSIDE
DMC: $5,100 TMC: $85,700 TDC $57,600 CUM Cost $1,503,715
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 6 7 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 41 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 SurF. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 13/13 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: H506ZX+ MS1666 Int. Cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 4/10 SPM: 110 MFG: HTC ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 10.4 GPM : 384 SIN: 7117833 5337 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 600

Cake: 2 Press: 1225 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $800
Solids/L.G. 11/5.9 AV DC: 325 Depth out: 11918 12344 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 197.7 Depth in: 11566 11918 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.7 JetVel: 105 FTG: 352 426 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/4.40 ECD: 10.59 Hrs; 18.5 35.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 10000 SPR #1 : FPH: 19.0 12.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #7 $ 14,000

Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 20/28 22132 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.25/0 Btms. Up: 61 R-RPM: 58/65 55/65 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Time Break Dow1: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA NA Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $5,TOO

START END TIME RM 30|DR 1.5 Total Rot. irs: 289.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc.I Labor: $ 7,700

6:00 11:30 5.5 DRILLFI12111' TO 12196' ROP = 15.45' shaker screens: $
11:30 12:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE Welding: : $
12:00 18:00 6 0 DRILL F/12196' TO 12252' ROP = 9.33'

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE TOP DRIVE Daily Total: $ 57,600

18:30 4:00 9.5 DRILLF/12252' TO 12344' ROP = 9.7 BHA

4:00 6:00 2.0 SLUG D P. & DROP SURVEY TOOL & POOH FOR BIT BIT 1 1.00
BIT SUB 1 3.30

RAtSE MUDWT. TO 10.5 PPG 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556 06

RECEIVED
JAN1 2 2003

DN.0FOLGAS

Total Hours 24.0
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' -99'

Wasatch 5420' -6924' Kenilworth 12460' 116'

Mesaverde 9250' •3094' Aberdeen 12570' 226'
Lower Measverd 10890" -1454' Spring canyt 12695' 351'
Castlegate 11760' -584' Mancos 12820' 476' TOTAL BHA = 560.36

Desert 12020' -324' MN-21 13180' 836' Survey 11,566'



CONFilENTIAL
GASCO o^SCO ENERGY 7' is R E S,ts

Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT Šd ŸÝ J

RKB 25.6" AFE#70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/13/2009 20

Current: Operations: ES ABLISHRETURNS g 6000'
Depth: 12382' Prog: 38' \D Hrs: 2.0 ROP 19.0 Formation:

,
SUNNYSIDE

DMC: $5,300 TMC: $85,700 TDC $93,500 CUM Cost $1,597,215
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGlBLE COST

MW: 10.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 7 8 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ 58 000
VIS: 42 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 15/14 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MS1666 MS1666 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $
Gel: 6/11 SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4 000

WL: 12 GPM : 384 SIN: 5337 5897 Float Equp: s - Trucking: 8
Cake: 2 Press: 1225 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $800
Souds(LG. î2/6.6 AV DC: 325 Depth out: 12344 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 197.7 Depth in: 11918 12344 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.8 JetVel: 105 FTG: 426 38 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/4.40 ECD: 10.59 Hrs: 35.5 2.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 9000 SPR #1 : FPH: 12.0 19.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #7 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 26/32 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.25/0 Stms. Up: 61 R-RPM: 58/63 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1 400

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA NA Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $5,300
START END TIME RM 30 l DR 1.5 Total Rot. Ars: 291.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $

6:00 10:30 4.5 CONT. POOH FOR B1T shaker screens: $
10:30 15:00 4.5 M/UNEW BIT#8 CHECK FLOATREPLACE SPRING RIH BREAKCIRC. @ 3400'& RIHTO 7100' Welding: : $

AND CIRC.

15:00 16:30 1.5 INSTALLROTATINGHEAD RUBBER & CIRC. OUT GAS Daily Total: $ 93,500

16:30 18:00 1.5 CONT. RiH TO F/7100' TO 9845' BREAKCIRC.OK CONT. RIHTO 10694' STOP DUE TO INCORRI BHA

DISPLACEMENTGAINED25 BBLS TO MUCH. BIT 1 1.00

18:00 20:00 2.0 TOP DRIVE UP &CIRC.OUT GAS @ 10694'.25' TO 45' FLAREGAINED65 BBLS TO MUDPITS & BIT SUB i 30
HADTO DUMP 60 BBLS. MUD WT.10.5 PPG 41 VIS OUT & 10.7 PPG IN 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06

20:00 21:00 1.0 RIH F/10694' TO 12195' OK

21:00 22:00 1.0 WASH & REAMF/12195' TO 12344' 100 SIKS FROM BOTTOMSUP TOOK A 114 WATER INFLUX

DUMP SAME TAG BOTTOM

22:00 0:00 2.0 BREAK IN BIT&DRILLF/12344' TO 12382' ROP = 19' {LOSTTOTALRF

0:00 1:00 1.0 ATTEMPTTO RE-GAIN RETURNS NO SUCCESS {LOSTA TOTALOF 100

1:00 5:00 4.0 POOH TO 6000' TO EST. RETURNS. WHILE POOH WORK ON BUILDINGVOLUME.

5:00 6:00 1.0 ATTEMPTTO RE-GAIN RETURNS AFTER PUMPING 45 BBLS HAVEFULLRETURNS @50 STKS

150PSI INCREASE IN5 STK INCREMENTSTO 90 STKS. Then stage in hole 10 stands at a time.

Total Hours 24.0
Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' •137

Wasatch 5420' -8962' Kenilworth 12460' 78'
Mesaverde 9250' •3132· Aberdeen 12570' 188'

Lower Measverd 10890' -1492' Spring canyt 12695' 313'
Castlegate 11760' -622• Mancos 12820' 438• TOTAL BHA = 560.36
Desert 12020' -362' MN-21 13180' 798' Survey 11,918 Miss Run

RECEIVED
JAN1 3 2009

m 0 DiLGAS&

CONFilENTIAL
GASCO o^SCO ENERGY 7' is R E S,ts

Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT Šd ŸÝ J

RKB 25.6" AFE#70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/13/2009 20

Current: Operations: ES ABLISHRETURNS g 6000'
Depth: 12382' Prog: 38' \D Hrs: 2.0 ROP 19.0 Formation:

,
SUNNYSIDE

DMC: $5,300 TMC: $85,700 TDC $93,500 CUM Cost $1,597,215
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGlBLE COST

MW: 10.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 7 8 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ 58 000
VIS: 42 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 15/14 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MS1666 MS1666 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $
Gel: 6/11 SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4 000

WL: 12 GPM : 384 SIN: 5337 5897 Float Equp: s - Trucking: 8
Cake: 2 Press: 1225 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $800
Souds(LG. î2/6.6 AV DC: 325 Depth out: 12344 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 197.7 Depth in: 11918 12344 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.8 JetVel: 105 FTG: 426 38 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/4.40 ECD: 10.59 Hrs: 35.5 2.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 9000 SPR #1 : FPH: 12.0 19.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #7 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 26/32 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.25/0 Stms. Up: 61 R-RPM: 58/63 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1 400

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA NA Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $5,300
START END TIME RM 30 l DR 1.5 Total Rot. Ars: 291.0 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $

6:00 10:30 4.5 CONT. POOH FOR B1T shaker screens: $
10:30 15:00 4.5 M/UNEW BIT#8 CHECK FLOATREPLACE SPRING RIH BREAKCIRC. @ 3400'& RIHTO 7100' Welding: : $

AND CIRC.

15:00 16:30 1.5 INSTALLROTATINGHEAD RUBBER & CIRC. OUT GAS Daily Total: $ 93,500

16:30 18:00 1.5 CONT. RiH TO F/7100' TO 9845' BREAKCIRC.OK CONT. RIHTO 10694' STOP DUE TO INCORRI BHA

DISPLACEMENTGAINED25 BBLS TO MUCH. BIT 1 1.00

18:00 20:00 2.0 TOP DRIVE UP &CIRC.OUT GAS @ 10694'.25' TO 45' FLAREGAINED65 BBLS TO MUDPITS & BIT SUB i 30
HADTO DUMP 60 BBLS. MUD WT.10.5 PPG 41 VIS OUT & 10.7 PPG IN 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06

20:00 21:00 1.0 RIH F/10694' TO 12195' OK

21:00 22:00 1.0 WASH & REAMF/12195' TO 12344' 100 SIKS FROM BOTTOMSUP TOOK A 114 WATER INFLUX

DUMP SAME TAG BOTTOM

22:00 0:00 2.0 BREAK IN BIT&DRILLF/12344' TO 12382' ROP = 19' {LOSTTOTALRF

0:00 1:00 1.0 ATTEMPTTO RE-GAIN RETURNS NO SUCCESS {LOSTA TOTALOF 100

1:00 5:00 4.0 POOH TO 6000' TO EST. RETURNS. WHILE POOH WORK ON BUILDINGVOLUME.

5:00 6:00 1.0 ATTEMPTTO RE-GAIN RETURNS AFTER PUMPING 45 BBLS HAVEFULLRETURNS @50 STKS

150PSI INCREASE IN5 STK INCREMENTSTO 90 STKS. Then stage in hole 10 stands at a time.

Total Hours 24.0

Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' •137

Wasatch 5420' -8962' Kenilworth 12460' 78'
Mesaverde 9250' •3132· Aberdeen 12570' 188'

Lower Measverd 10890' -1492' Spring canyt 12695' 313'
Castlegate 11760' -622• Mancos 12820' 438• TOTAL BHA = 560.36

Desert 12020' -362' MN-21 13180' 798' Survey 11,918 Miss Run

RECEIVED
JAN1 3 2009

m 0 DiLGAS&



CONFilENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY 7, gg ,

Energy DAILYDRILLING REPORT C/3- o C/ 3 †// 4
RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1114/2009 21
Current: Operations: DRILUNG
Depth: 12525' Prog: 143' D Hrs: 8.5 ROP 16.8 Formation: KENILWORTH
DMC: $15,900 TMC: $106,900 TDC $58,100 CUM Cost $1,655,315
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.8 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 7 8 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 41 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 15/14 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MS1666 MS1666 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 6/12 SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 12.4 GPM : 384 SIN: 5337 5897 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 2 Press: 1225 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $800
SolidslL.G. 13/6.6 AV DC: 298 Depth out: 12344 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 227 Depth in: 11918 12344 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH: 7.6 JetVel: 95 FTG: 426 181 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 11.09 Hrs: 35.5 10.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 7500 SPR #1 : FPH: 12.0 17.3 Heater: $ - Bit: # 8 $ 12,000
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 26/32 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 3.85/5% Btms. Up: 70 R-RPM: 58/65 5ßl63 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Tirie Break Dowi: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA NA Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $15,900
START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1.5 Total Rot. irs: 299.5 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $

6:00 16:00 10.0 STAGE IN HOLE 11 STANDS ATATIME F/6,044'TO 11,200'& BREAKCIRC. NO LOSSES shaker screens: $
16:00 16:30 0.5 STARTED RUNNING IINHOLE WITH 10 STANDS ON STD 6 HOLE STARTED DISPLAClNG To Welding: : $ -

MUCH MUDWELL FLOWINGGAINED70 BBLS

16:30 18:30 2.0 CIRC. OUT GAS &WELL TOOK BACK58 BBLS. FLARE28' TO 38' Daily Total: $ 58,100
18:30 19:00 0.5 RIHTO 12196' OK BHA

19:00 20:30 1.5 REAM &WASH SLOW TO BOTTOM BIT 1 1.00
20:30 0:00 3.5 DRILLF/12382' TO 12,44T STARTED LOSING MUD BIT SUB 1 3.30
0:00 1:00 1.0 P/U OFF BOTTOM& CIRC. HOLE CLEAN & PUMP LCMPILL 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06
1:00 6:00 5.0 DRILLF/12,44T TO 12,525' NO LOSSES

Total Hours 24.0
Deptti Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' -280'

Wasatch 5420' -7105' Kenilworth 12460' -65'

Mesaverde 9250' -3275' Aberdeen 12570' 45'

Lower Measverd 10890' -1635' Spring canyi 12695' 170'
Castlegate 11760°

-765' Mancos 12820' 295' TOTAL BHA = 560.36
Desert 12020' -505' MN-21 13180' 655• Survey 11,918 Miss Rum

RECEIVED
JAN1 4 2009

OlV.0FOIL,GAS&

CONFilENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY 7, gg ,

Energy DAILYDRILLING REPORT C/3- o C/ 3 †// 4
RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1114/2009 21
Current: Operations: DRILUNG
Depth: 12525' Prog: 143' D Hrs: 8.5 ROP 16.8 Formation: KENILWORTH
DMC: $15,900 TMC: $106,900 TDC $58,100 CUM Cost $1,655,315
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.8 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 7 8 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 41 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 15/14 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MS1666 MS1666 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 6/12 SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 12.4 GPM : 384 SIN: 5337 5897 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 2 Press: 1225 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $800
SolidslL.G. 13/6.6 AV DC: 298 Depth out: 12344 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 12.5 AV DP: 227 Depth in: 11918 12344 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH: 7.6 JetVel: 95 FTG: 426 181 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $
PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 11.09 Hrs: 35.5 10.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 7500 SPR #1 : FPH: 12.0 17.3 Heater: $ - Bit: # 8 $ 12,000

Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 26/32 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 3.85/5% Btms. Up: 70 R-RPM: 58/65 5ßl63 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Tirie Break Dowi: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA NA Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $15,900
START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1.5 Total Rot. irs: 299.5 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $

6:00 16:00 10.0 STAGE IN HOLE 11 STANDS ATATIME F/6,044'TO 11,200'& BREAKCIRC. NO LOSSES shaker screens: $
16:00 16:30 0.5 STARTED RUNNING IINHOLE WITH 10 STANDS ON STD 6 HOLE STARTED DISPLAClNG To Welding: : $ -

MUCH MUDWELL FLOWINGGAINED70 BBLS

16:30 18:30 2.0 CIRC. OUT GAS &WELL TOOK BACK58 BBLS. FLARE28' TO 38' Daily Total: $ 58,100
18:30 19:00 0.5 RIHTO 12196' OK BHA

19:00 20:30 1.5 REAM &WASH SLOW TO BOTTOM BIT 1 1.00
20:30 0:00 3.5 DRILLF/12382' TO 12,44T STARTED LOSING MUD BIT SUB 1 3.30
0:00 1:00 1.0 P/U OFF BOTTOM& CIRC. HOLE CLEAN & PUMP LCMPILL 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06
1:00 6:00 5.0 DRILLF/12,44T TO 12,525' NO LOSSES

Total Hours 24.0
Deptti Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' -280'

Wasatch 5420' -7105' Kenilworth 12460' -65'

Mesaverde 9250' -3275' Aberdeen 12570' 45'

Lower Measverd 10890' -1635' Spring canyi 12695' 170'
Castlegate 11760°

-765' Mancos 12820' 295' TOTAL BHA = 560.36
Desert 12020' -505' MN-21 13180' 655• Survey 11,918 Miss Rum

RECEIVED
JAN1 4 2009

OlV.0FOIL,GAS&



CONFllEN11ALGASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Weil: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 ilf5/2000 22

Current: Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 12608' Prog: 83' D Hrs: 4.5 ROP 18.4 Formation: ABERDEEN
DMC: $9 600 TMC: $116,500 TDC $41,000 CUM Cost $1,696,315
Contractor: NABORS 99 Mud Co: MI DRLGFLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11 #1 F-1000 3.5 ppm Bit #: 8 - Loc,Cost: $
VÏS: 43 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf, Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 15-16 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: MS‡666 504xx int. Csq $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 6/12 SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 12 GPM : 384 SIN: 5897 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 2 Press: 1550 Jets: 6x16's 6xt6's Well Head: $ - Water: $400
Solids/L.G. 12/5.8 AV DC 298 Depth out: 12547 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MS Depth in: 12344 P - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.6 JetVel: 95 FTG: 203 61 Tanks: $ - Canip n
PflMf: 00/3 40 ECD: 11.09 Hrs: 12.0 - Cement: $
Chlor: 7500 SPR #1 : FPH: 17 0 20.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #9 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22132 $ - Mud Motors : $
D 4/trace Btms.Up: 71 R-RPM: 58/65 P - Consultant: $ 1,400

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA 75 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $9600

START END TIME RM36] DR 1.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 299 5 Daily Total: $ - Misc.1 Labor: $
6:00 7:30 1.5 DRILLF/12525 TO 12547 shaker screens: $
7:30 8:00 0.5 1696316 Welding: : $ _-

8:00 15:00 7 0 POOH L/D Bff & BITSUB

& RIH TO SHOE BREAKCIRC Daily Total: $ 41,000

17:30 18:30 1 0 SLIP &CUT DRILLINGLINE BHA

18:30 19:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG BIT 1 1.00

19:00 21:30 2.5 RIN TO 8000' MM .22 1 33.14

21:30 23:00 1 5 ciRc. OUT GAS 6 114 6

23:00 1:30 2.5 RIHTO 12,417'

1:30 2:30 1.0 WASH & REAM F/12417' TO 1254T

12601' ROP = 21.5

RK ON BOTMMUDPUMPS
5:30 6:00 0.5 DRILLF/12601 TO 12608'

Total Hours 24.0
Demfh Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' -363'

Wasatch 5420' -7188 Kenîlworth 12460' 448'
Mesaverde 12570' -38'

t.owerMeasverd 10890 4718 Spring cany 12695' 87'
Castlegate 11760 12820' 212' TOTAL BHA = 590.20
Desert 12020' -588' MN-21 13100' 572' Survey 11,918 Miss Run

RECE1VED
JAN112009

OlV.0F0tL,

CONFllEN11ALGASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Weil: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 ilf5/2000 22

Current: Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 12608' Prog: 83' D Hrs: 4.5 ROP 18.4 Formation: ABERDEEN
DMC: $9 600 TMC: $116,500 TDC $41,000 CUM Cost $1,696,315
Contractor: NABORS 99 Mud Co: MI DRLGFLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11 #1 F-1000 3.5 ppm Bit #: 8 - Loc,Cost: $
VÏS: 43 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf, Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 15-16 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: MS‡666 504xx int. Csq $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 6/12 SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 12 GPM : 384 SIN: 5897 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 2 Press: 1550 Jets: 6x16's 6xt6's Well Head: $ - Water: $400
Solids/L.G. 12/5.8 AV DC 298 Depth out: 12547 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MS Depth in: 12344 P - Casing Crew: $
PH: 7.6 JetVel: 95 FTG: 203 61 Tanks: $ - Canip n
PflMf: 00/3 40 ECD: 11.09 Hrs: 12.0 - Cement: $
Chlor: 7500 SPR #1 : FPH: 17 0 20.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #9 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22132 $ - Mud Motors : $
D 4/trace Btms.Up: 71 R-RPM: 58/65 P - Consultant: $ 1,400

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA 75 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $9600

START END TIME RM36] DR 1.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 299 5 Daily Total: $ - Misc.1 Labor: $
6:00 7:30 1.5 DRILLF/12525 TO 12547 shaker screens: $
7:30 8:00 0.5 1696316 Welding: : $ _-

8:00 15:00 7 0 POOH L/D Bff & BITSUB

& RIH TO SHOE BREAKCIRC Daily Total: $ 41,000

17:30 18:30 1 0 SLIP &CUT DRILLINGLINE BHA

18:30 19:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG BIT 1 1.00

19:00 21:30 2.5 RIN TO 8000' MM .22 1 33.14

21:30 23:00 1 5 ciRc. OUT GAS 6 114 6

23:00 1:30 2.5 RIHTO 12,417'

1:30 2:30 1.0 WASH & REAM F/12417' TO 1254T

12601' ROP = 21.5

RK ON BOTMMUDPUMPS

5:30 6:00 0.5 DRILLF/12601 TO 12608'

Total Hours 24.0

Demfh Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' -363'

Wasatch 5420' -7188 Kenîlworth 12460' 448'
Mesaverde 12570' -38'

t.owerMeasverd 10890 4718 Spring cany 12695' 87'
Castlegate 11760 12820' 212' TOTAL BHA = 590.20

Desert 12020' -588' MN-21 13100' 572' Survey 11,918 Miss Run

RECE1VED
JAN112009

OlV.0F0tL,



CONRDENRGASCO GASCO ENERGY . 7, a pyg
DAILYDRILLING REPORTEnergy -m-sn y

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/16/2009 23
Current: Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 13179' Prog: 571' D Hrs: 16.0 ROP 35.7 Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $11,000 TMC: $127,500 TDC $41,400 CUM Cost $1,737,715
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRLt FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11 #1 F-1000 3.5 ppm Bit #: 8 9 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 45 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 16/15 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MS1666 504zx Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 6/13 SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 14 GPM : 384 SIN: 5897 7117470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 2 Press: 1650 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $600
SolidslL.G. 13/6 AV DC: 298 Depth out: 12547 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 13.75 AV DP: 227 Depth in: 12344 12547 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH: 7.6 JetVel: 95 FTG: 203 632 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $ 400

PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 11.09 Hrs: 12.0 19.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 7000 SPR #1 : FPH: 17.0 33.3 Heater: $ - Bit: #9 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 22/25 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.75/Trace Btms. Up: 71 R-RPM: 58/65 Oct-40 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Tinae Break Dowi: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA 78 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $11,000
START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1.5 Total Rot. irs: 315.5 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $

6:00 7:00 1.0 DRILLF/12508' TO 12629' shaker screens: $
7:00 8:30 1.5 DOWNTIME:WORK ON MUD PUMPS Welding: : $ -

8:30 13:00 4.5 DRILLF/12629" TO 12771'

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG Daily Total: $ 41,400

13:30 15:30 2.0 DRILLF/12771' TO 12830' BHA

15:30 16:00 0.5 DOWNTIME:WORK ON MUD PUMPS BIT 1 1.00

16:00 17:30 1.5 DRILLF/12830° TO 12892' MM .22 1 33.14

17:30 18:30 1.0 STARTED LOSING MUDP/U OFF BOTTOMCIRC. HOLE CLEAN &TAKE OFF GAS BUSTER TO 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06
REDUCE ECD ON HOLE & PUMP LCMPILL

18:30 22:00 3.5 DRILLF/12892' TO 13049'

22:00 2:30 4.5 TOOK 130 BBL GAININABOUT 14 MINTUES.PUTON GAS BUSTER & BLEW GASKET ON FLOW

UNE SHUT IN HYDRIL& GO ON CHQKE TO CIRC. OUT GAS. {BLEWDOWN CHOKE}

2:30 6:00 3.5 DRILLF/13049' TO 13179' ROP = 39.T

DE3EIVED
JAll1 G21109

Total Hours 24.0

Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' -934· DNOFG1, GAS8 MINING
Wasatch 5420' -7759' Kenilworth 12460' -719'

Mesaverde 9250' -3929' Aberdeen 12570' -609'

Lower Measverd 10890' -2289' Spring canyt 12695' -484'

Castlegate 11760' -1419' Mancos 12820' -359' TOTAL BHA = 590.20

Desert 12020' -1159' MN-21 13180' 1• Survey 11,918 Miss

CONRDENRGASCO GASCO ENERGY . 7, a pyg
DAILYDRILLING REPORTEnergy -m-sn y

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1/16/2009 23

Current: Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 13179' Prog: 571' D Hrs: 16.0 ROP 35.7 Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $11,000 TMC: $127,500 TDC $41,400 CUM Cost $1,737,715
Contractor: NABORS99 Mud Co: MI DRLt FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11 #1 F-1000 3.5 ppm Bit #: 8 9 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 45 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 7/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 16/15 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MS1666 504zx Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 6/13 SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental: $ 4,000

WL: 14 GPM : 384 SIN: 5897 7117470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 2 Press: 1650 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ - Water: $600
SolidslL.G. 13/6 AV DC: 298 Depth out: 12547 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 13.75 AV DP: 227 Depth in: 12344 12547 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH: 7.6 JetVel: 95 FTG: 203 632 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $ 400

PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 11.09 Hrs: 12.0 19.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 7000 SPR #1 : FPH: 17.0 33.3 Heater: $ - Bit: #9 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 22/25 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.75/Trace Btms. Up: 71 R-RPM: 58/65 Oct-40 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Tinae Break Dowi: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA 78 Misc: $ - Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $11,000
START END TIME RM 36 I DR 1.5 Total Rot. irs: 315.5 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $

6:00 7:00 1.0 DRILLF/12508' TO 12629' shaker screens: $
7:00 8:30 1.5 DOWNTIME:WORK ON MUD PUMPS Welding: : $ -

8:30 13:00 4.5 DRILLF/12629" TO 12771'

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG Daily Total: $ 41,400

13:30 15:30 2.0 DRILLF/12771' TO 12830' BHA

15:30 16:00 0.5 DOWNTIME:WORK ON MUD PUMPS BIT 1 1.00

16:00 17:30 1.5 DRILLF/12830° TO 12892' MM .22 1 33.14

17:30 18:30 1.0 STARTED LOSING MUDP/U OFF BOTTOMCIRC. HOLE CLEAN &TAKE OFF GAS BUSTER TO 6 1/4" D.C. 18 556.06

REDUCE ECD ON HOLE & PUMP LCMPILL

18:30 22:00 3.5 DRILLF/12892' TO 13049'

22:00 2:30 4.5 TOOK 130 BBL GAININABOUT 14 MINTUES.PUTON GAS BUSTER & BLEW GASKET ON FLOW

UNE SHUT IN HYDRIL& GO ON CHQKE TO CIRC. OUT GAS. {BLEWDOWN CHOKE}

2:30 6:00 3.5 DRILLF/13049' TO 13179' ROP = 39.T

DE3EIVED
JAll1 G21109

Total Hours 24.0

Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' -934· DNOFG1, GAS8 MINING
Wasatch 5420' -7759' Kenilworth 12460' -719'

Mesaverde 9250' -3929' Aberdeen 12570' -609'

Lower Measverd 10890' -2289' Spring canyt 12695' -484'

Castlegate 11760' -1419' Mancos 12820' -359' TOTAL BHA = 590.20

Desert 12020' -1159' MN-21 13180' 1• Survey 11,918 Miss



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy n on-see

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1122/2009 29

Current: Operations: FINAL REPORT PREP RIG FOR MOVE
Depth: 13415' Prog: D Hrs: ROP #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS/MN21
DMC: TMC: $149,000 TDC $29,200 CUM Cost $2,508,200
Contractor: NABORS 99 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 8 9 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 45 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 16/16 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: MS1666 504zx Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 6/14 SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA HTC Prod Csg: $ Rental: $ 3,000

WL: 15.2 GPM : 384 SIN: 5897 7117470 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: 2 Press: 1650 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ Water: $
Solids/L.G. 15/6.5 AV DC: 298 Depth out: 12547 13415 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 13.75 AV DP: 227 Depth in: 12344 12547 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: . $
PH: 7.6 JetVel: 95 FTG: 203 868 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $800
PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 11.09 Hrs: 12.0 26.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 7000 SPR #1 : FPH: 17.0 33.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #9 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 22/25 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.5/Trace Btms. Up: 76 R-RPM: 58/65 75 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Tin e Break Dow 1: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA 78 Misc: $ Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $
START END TIME RM36 I DR4 Total Rot. irs: 315.5 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $

6:00 18:00 12.0 NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S THIRD PARTYTOOLS FAILED,SO WHILEWAITINGON OTHER COMPAN Electric logging: $
TO NIPPLE DOWN BOP. RIG DOWN FLOOR, CHOKE HOUSE, UNHOOK FLARE LINES & MUD Welding: : $
TANKS. NIPPLE DOWN BOP & MOVE. MOVE CAMP &SET UP SAME. MOVE PIPE TUBS,

WATER TANKS & PREP TOP DRIVETO LAYDOWN & DERRICK BOARD. UNHOOK POWER FRO Daily Total: $ 29,200
TOP DRIVE. BHA

18:00 6:00 12.0 SHUT IN BOILER, BLOW DOWN STEM LINES, WATER LINES,RIG DOWN FLOW LINE. GO THRU

MUDPUMPS, PULL#2 HOPPER PUMP OUT & REPLACE HOPPER JET.

DECEIVED
JAN2 2 ¿Q09

DIVnFoll, AN NNG

Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' -1170'

Wasatch 5420' -7995' Kenilworth 12460' -955'

Mesaverde 9250' -4165' Aberdeen 12570' -845'

Lower Measverd 10890' -2525' Spring canyt 12695' -720'

Castlegate 11760°
-1655' Mancos 12820' -595' TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Desert 12020' -1395' MN-21 13180' -235'

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy n on-see

RKB 25.6" AFE #70402 GPS= LONG 40.00.413N LAT 109.50.392W
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Days since spud:

SWF 31-25-9-18 13,410 13,410 1122/2009 29

Current: Operations: FINAL REPORT PREP RIG FOR MOVE
Depth: 13415' Prog: D Hrs: ROP #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS/MN21
DMC: TMC: $149,000 TDC $29,200 CUM Cost $2,508,200
Contractor: NABORS 99 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 8 9 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 45 SPM: 0 Size: 7 7/8 7 718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 16/16 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: MS1666 504zx Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 6/14 SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA HTC Prod Csg: $ Rental: $ 3,000

WL: 15.2 GPM : 384 SIN: 5897 7117470 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: 2 Press: 1650 Jets: 6x16's 6x16's Well Head: $ Water: $
Solids/L.G. 15/6.5 AV DC: 298 Depth out: 12547 13415 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT: 13.75 AV DP: 227 Depth in: 12344 12547 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: . $
PH: 7.6 JetVel: 95 FTG: 203 868 Tanks: $ - Camp Exp: $800
PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 11.09 Hrs: 12.0 26.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $
Chlor: 7000 SPR #1 : FPH: 17.0 33.0 Heater: $ - Bit: #9 $
Ca: 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 22/25 $ - Mud Motors : $
DAPILCM 4.5/Trace Btms. Up: 76 R-RPM: 58/65 75 Prime Mover: $ - Consultant: $ 1,400

Tin e Break Dow 1: Total D.T. M-RPM: NA 78 Misc: $ Drilling Mud, and DP chem: $
START END TIME RM36 I DR4 Total Rot. irs: 315.5 Daily Total: $ - Misc. I Labor: $

6:00 18:00 12.0 NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S THIRD PARTYTOOLS FAILED,SO WHILEWAITINGON OTHER COMPAN Electric logging: $
TO NIPPLE DOWN BOP. RIG DOWN FLOOR, CHOKE HOUSE, UNHOOK FLARE LINES & MUD Welding: : $
TANKS. NIPPLE DOWN BOP & MOVE. MOVE CAMP &SET UP SAME. MOVE PIPE TUBS,

WATER TANKS & PREP TOP DRIVETO LAYDOWN & DERRICK BOARD. UNHOOK POWER FRO Daily Total: $ 29,200

TOP DRIVE. BHA

18:00 6:00 12.0 SHUT IN BOILER, BLOW DOWN STEM LINES, WATER LINES,RIG DOWN FLOW LINE. GO THRU

MUDPUMPS, PULL#2 HOPPER PUMP OUT & REPLACE HOPPER JET.

DECEIVED
JAN2 2 ¿Q09

DIVnFoll, AN NNG

Depth Feet To Go Sunnyside 12245' -1170'

Wasatch 5420' -7995' Kenilworth 12460' -955'

Mesaverde 9250' -4165' Aberdeen 12570' -845'

Lower Measverd 10890' -2525' Spring canyt 12695' -720'

Castlegate 11760°
-1655' Mancos 12820' -595' TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Desert 12020' -1395' MN-21 13180' -235'



Foun 3165 UNITEDSTATES(April2004) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,Allotteeor TribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 {APD) for such proposais- NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Otherinstructlons on reverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

NA
1. Type of 11

OilWell GasWell O Okr 8. WeHNameand Na
2. NameofOperator Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. API WellNo.

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo.(include area code) 43-047-39729

8 INVERNESS DR. E, #100, ENGLEWOOD, CO 80112 30m 10.FieldandPool,or ExploratoryArea

4. IncationofWell (Footage,Sec.,T, R.,M, or SurveyDescription) Riverbend

853' FNL & 2132' FEL 11. Countyor Parish, State

NW NE of Sec 25-T98-R18E

11 CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NGIICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Produedon (Stan/Resume) WaterShut-OŒ
Noticeof Intent AlterCasing FractureTæat Reclamation We1Hnegrhy

O SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other Complete and

ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporarilyAbandon cminge multple
O FinalAbandonmentNotice Convertto Igetion PlugBack WaterDisposal pay -

13. DescribeProposedorCompletedOperation(clearlystateallpertinentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdateof any proposedwork andapproximate durationthereof.
If theproposalistodeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasured and truevertical depthsof all pertinentmarkersand zones.
AttachtheBondunder which theworkwill be performedor providetheBondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequentreports shallbefiledwithin 30days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. Iftheoperation results ina multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval,a Form3160-4shall be filedonce
testinghasbeencompleted.FinalAbandonmentNoticesshallbe filedonlyafterall requirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted,andtheoperator has
determinedthatthesiteis readyforfinalinspection.)

Gasco intends to complete productive intervais in the Mancos and Mesaverde formations and to commingle production from these intervals.
Following final fracture stimulation a Completion Report willbe submitted.

No new surface disturbance is anticipated. Ifany is necessary, prior approval willbe obtained.

If required, the method used to account for and allocateproduction from each pool so commingled willbe by individual interval hydrocarbon pore
volume calculation.

Gasco Production Company has provided the owners of all contiguous oil and gas leases or drillingunits overlying the pools to be commingled with
a copy of thisapplication. Gasco therefore respectfully requests that the Division accept this application, with attachments, in lieu of the required
affidavit with regard to notification of the aforementioned owners.

Attachment: Exhibit showing the location of all well on contiguous oil and gas leases or drillingunits overlying the subject pools.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Matt Owens Title Petroleum Engineer

THIS SPAC FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby Title , Dam 3
Conditionsof ap a , if any,areattached. Approvalof thisnotice doesnot warrant or FederalApprovalUt 0118
certifythat the applicantholdslegalor equitabletitle to thoserights in thesubject lease Office ACÌi0018Necessary
which would entitletheapplicanttoconductoperationsthereon. ÛÛf/

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43U.S.C.Section1212,makeit a crime forany personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency ofthe United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsasto anymatterwithin its jurisdiction. RECElVED
(Instructionson page 2) COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

Date: g en og = FEB\ O2009
initials: DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

Foun 3165 UNITEDSTATES(April2004) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,Allotteeor TribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 {APD) for such proposais- NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Otherinstructlons on reverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

NA
1. Type of 11

OilWell GasWell O Okr 8. WeHNameand Na

2. NameofOperator Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. API WellNo.

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo.(include area code) 43-047-39729

8 INVERNESS DR. E, #100, ENGLEWOOD, CO 80112 30m 10.FieldandPool,or ExploratoryArea

4. IncationofWell (Footage,Sec.,T, R.,M, or SurveyDescription) Riverbend

853' FNL & 2132' FEL 11. Countyor Parish, State

NW NE of Sec 25-T98-R18E

11 CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NGIICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Produedon (Stan/Resume) WaterShut-OŒ
Noticeof Intent AlterCasing FractureTæat Reclamation We1Hnegrhy

O SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other Complete and

ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporarilyAbandon cminge multple
O FinalAbandonmentNotice Convertto Igetion PlugBack WaterDisposal pay -

13. DescribeProposedorCompletedOperation(clearlystateallpertinentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdateof any proposedwork andapproximate durationthereof.
If theproposalistodeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasured and truevertical depthsof all pertinentmarkersand zones.
AttachtheBondunder which theworkwill be performedor providetheBondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequentreports shallbefiledwithin 30days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. Iftheoperation results ina multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval,a Form3160-4shall be filedonce
testinghasbeencompleted.FinalAbandonmentNoticesshallbe filedonlyafterall requirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted,andtheoperator has
determinedthatthesiteis readyforfinalinspection.)

Gasco intends to complete productive intervais in the Mancos and Mesaverde formations and to commingle production from these intervals.
Following final fracture stimulation a Completion Report willbe submitted.

No new surface disturbance is anticipated. Ifany is necessary, prior approval willbe obtained.

If required, the method used to account for and allocateproduction from each pool so commingled willbe by individual interval hydrocarbon pore
volume calculation.

Gasco Production Company has provided the owners of all contiguous oil and gas leases or drillingunits overlying the pools to be commingled with
a copy of thisapplication. Gasco therefore respectfully requests that the Division accept this application, with attachments, in lieu of the required
affidavit with regard to notification of the aforementioned owners.

Attachment: Exhibit showing the location of all well on contiguous oil and gas leases or drillingunits overlying the subject pools.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Matt Owens Title Petroleum Engineer

THIS SPAC FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby Title , Dam 3
Conditionsof ap a , if any,areattached. Approvalof thisnotice doesnot warrant or FederalApprovalUt 0118
certifythat the applicantholdslegalor equitabletitle to thoserights in thesubject lease Office ACÌi0018Necessary
which would entitletheapplicanttoconductoperationsthereon. ÛÛf/

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43U.S.C.Section1212,makeit a crime forany personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency ofthe United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsasto anymatterwithin its jurisdiction. RECElVED
(Instructionson page 2) COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

Date: g en og = FEB\ O2009
initials: DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



NEWFIELD R DUCTION

NEWFIELD ODUCTION FEDERA 5-24-9-18
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SHEEP WASH FEDERAL
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GASCO
Energy
February 2, 2009

RECEIVEDNewfield Exploration Company
1401 Seventeenth St., Suite 1000 Ñ Î Û
Denver, Colorado 80202
Attention: Ms. KellyDonohue DIVOFOIL,GAS&AflNING
Via email: kdonohoue@newfield.com

RE: Notice of Intent to Completion into Two or More Pools
Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18 located in the NW¾NE¾,
Section 18-Township 9 South-Range 18 East
Uintah County, UT

Kelly:

Gasco Production Company is applying to the Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining ("UDOGM") for
authorization to complete the subject well into twoor more pools, the Mancos formation and the
Mesaverde formation.

Pursuant to Rule 649-3-22 of UDOGM Rules and Regulations, Gasco Production Company does
herewith advise Newfield Exploration Company, as the owner of contiguous oil and gas leases or
drilling units overlyingthe pools, of our intention to complete and commingle production on the
subject well. Unless you have objection to thiscomminglingplan, no actionis required on your
part. If you do feel a need to object to this comminglingplan, those comments should be directed
to: UDOGM

Attn: Dustin Doucet
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Objections will be accepted up to 15 days after Gasco's application is filed with the Division
(R649-3-22.3.1). If you have any questions or concerns, please contact me at 303-996-1812.

Yo

David R. Smith
Manager, Land and Regulatory Affairs

GASCO Production Company Tel: (303) 483-0044

8 invemess Drive East, Suite 100 Fax (303) 483-00¾
Englewood, CO 80112-5626 Email:
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Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED(^9'u2004) DEPARTMENT OF T OMBNo. 1004-0137
BUREAU OF LAND

y Expires: March 31, 2007

e Serial No,SUNDRY NOTICES AND R UTU-009803Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Nameabandoned weß. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. N/A
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side.

7.¯If
Unit okA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well N/AO- U- OOther 8. Well Name and No.
2. NameofOperator

Sheep Wash Federal31-25-9-18Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (incInle area code) 43-047-397298 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. FieldandPool,orExploratory Area4. Location of WelI(Footage, Sec., T.,R., M., or SurveyDescription]

WiIdeat853' FNL & 2132' FEL I1. CountyorParish,State
NW NE of Sec 25-T9S-R18E

Uintah County, UT12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Repoit Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Status Sundy

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperations(cleady state all pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting dateof anyproposedworkandapptoximate durationthereofIf the proposalis to deependirotionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measuredandtrue vertical depthsof all pertinent markersand zones.Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor provide the Bond No. on filewith BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowing completion of the involved operations. If theoperation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form31604 shall be filed oncetestinghas been completed. Final AbandonmentNoticesshallbe filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdeterminedthat the site isready forfinal inspection.

This well reached TD 1/17/09. Completion operations have been suspended on this well until
prices just the operation.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

TitleJessica Berg
Production Clerk

Signature Date
4 ÄQ,A J/\ May 4, 2009

TH
'

PACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title DateConditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant orcertify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject least Officewhich would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C.Section 1212,make it a crime for any person knowingt ud y department or agency of the UnitedStates any false, fictitiousorfraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction. ; -(Instructions on page 2)

gg i 2 2009

DN.0FOlL,GAS&
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'

PACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title DateConditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant orcertify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject least Officewhich would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
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CONFIDENTIAL
von.neo.« UNITEDSTATES venumeraeven

Witzooo DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR OMBN 1906 m
BUREAUOFLAND MANAGEMENT

5. LeaseserialNo
SUNDRY NOTICES AND I(EPORTS ON WELLS UTU-009803

Do not use gris fann for proposals to driti or to re-enter en 6. If Indian¿Alloueo,or TribeWame
abandoned watt Use Fonn 3100-3 (APD}ibt such proposals. N/A

SUBMITIN TRIPUCATE - Other InstracGons on toverse side. g. If Unitor CA.AgreementNameand/or Nå
N/A

I. Typeof WellO- U- Om 4 WelfNmneud No.

2. NameofOperator Siteep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. Ai'l WenNo
3a. Addresi 3b. PhoneNo.(IncItufeamr code; 43-047-39729

8 inverness Drive East Ste 100 Engjewood, Co 801 12 303-483-0044 10. Field andPool,orExploratoryArea

4. LocationofWelI(Footage,&w.,T.,R.,M,orßurmpeserptianJ Wildcat
853' FNL & 2132' FEL R. Countyarfarish.State

NW NE of Sec 25-T9S-RISE Uintah County, UT

12, CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(S) TO INDICATENATUREOFNOTICE,REPORT OR OTHERDATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ÅCTION

ONodmm Acidize Deepm on(mm) WM

O- • O-- On-a-- Ow·-2
SubsequentReport Caá r Nw Co em Rm e Other Status Sundry

Oo - Om····«awaD, =•

FinalAbandonment No&e C a n Phtg back myod

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(cleady state all pertinent details, includingestimated startíngdate of any proposed work and approximatedumtion thereof
If the proposalis to deependir etionallyor recompletehorizontally, givesubsurfacelocationaand measured and true vetticaldepths ofall pertinentmarkers and zones.
AttadttheBond unde whichthe workwillbe performedor providetheBondNo.on lile with BLlWBIA.RequiredWatuentlepotts shallbe filedwithin30days
following completion of theinvolvaiopemtions. If theopemtion lesults in a multiplecompletionor secompktion ina new interval,a Form 31604 shall be liled once
testing has been completed. Final AbandonmentNoticesshall be filed onlyafkr all requirements, including reclamation, havebeencompleted,and the operator has
determinedthatthesite isready ibr finalinspection.

This well reached a TD of l 3,415' on 1/1'l/09. Nofurtherwork has been done on this well since
that time. Completionoperations are planned to begin thefirstweek of Dec¢mber. Completion

progress reports willhe e-mailed on a weeklybasisuntil work is complete, at which time we will
filea completion report.

RECEIVED
DECD32009

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

14. iherebycertifythat the foregoingis tme andcorrect.
Name(Prerer Typeg

Tide
Jessica Ber Production Clerk

signature Date
November 30, 2009

T S PACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE OFFICE USIË

Approved Title Date
Conditionsof ap liõval, if any are attaebed.Approvalof thisnotice does not warrant os
certifythat the applicantholds legal er equitabletitle to thoserightsinthe subject least Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduci operations thereon
Tide 18 U S.C. Section 1001 ANDTitle 43 U S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any personknowinglyand willfullyto Make any departmentor agency of the Unged
Statesany false,fictitionsorfraudulentstatementsor representationsas to any matterwithinits jurisdiction.



CONFllENTIAL
GASCO Production Company

Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18
NW NE Sec. 25-T9S-R18E

853' FNL, 2132' FEL
Uintah County, Utah
API: 43-047-39729

Drilling CWC: $2,508,200 RECEIVED
TOC inside surface esg.

DECO3 2009
01/27/09 Misc. drilling costs, start tank battery

(PME) DC $ 18,006 CC $2,526,206 DIVOFOILGAS&MINING

01/30/09 Tanks, Berm Material delivered Material
(PME) DC $36,295 CC $2,562,501

02/23/09 Restrooms, trash, separator & Meter house
(PME) DC $52,729 CC $2,615,230

03/04/09 Fittings (PME) DC $150 CC $2,615,380

11/16/09 Build Tank battery (PME) DC $6,742 CC 2,622,122

Completion: Mobe 1, frac MN 21 - Panther - Spring Canyon, w/ Pinnacle
Micro seismic on offset loc

11/17/09 RU JW Wireline. Ran CBL / VDL / GR log. Found TOC in surface esg,
above 3380'. Found very good / excellent bonding throughout, with the
exception of free pipe from 12100' to 12280'. Must have had some
trouble cementing, and pumped a water spacer.
* special considerations should be taken, designing frac stages around
this interval.* (SCE)

11/24/09 All frac tks cleaned and set for frac. Kcl and Biocide added and tks are
being filled now.

12/2/09 MIRU stinger wellhead. Will have frac crew/perforaters on loc in the a.m.
SDFD. (JD)

12/3/09 MIRU JW wireline. RIH perf guns. Pinnacle will calibrate tools f/SWF
21-25-9-18 loc, will also be monitoring frac job from SWF 21-25. Perf
stage-1 MN-21 f/13,175-79', 13,193-97', 13,215-19'. 3 spf, MIRU
Superior ws to frac. Break perfs w/7,250 @4.7 bpm. SD, ISIP 6,495,
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.93. pump 1,000 gal 7.5% hel @5 bpm. Reactive FR frac well w/5,682 #
100 mesh sand, 39,998# 40/70 white sand, 57,914# 40/70 prime plus,
2,559 bbls reactive FR water (2% Dychlor produced water), and flushed
w/194 bbls 2% Dychlor water. SD. ISIP 6,419 FG .92 Average rate 35.6
bpm, Average psi 7,771. Shut well in and SDFD.

.93. pump 1,000 gal 7.5% hel @5 bpm. Reactive FR frac well w/5,682 #
100 mesh sand, 39,998# 40/70 white sand, 57,914# 40/70 prime plus,
2,559 bbls reactive FR water (2% Dychlor produced water), and flushed
w/194 bbls 2% Dychlor water. SD. ISIP 6,419 FG .92 Average rate 35.6
bpm, Average psi 7,771. Shut well in and SDFD.



.93. pump 1,000 gal 7.5% hcl w/5,682 #
100 mesh sand, 39,998# 40/70 white sand, 57,914# 40/70 prime plus,
2,559 bbls reactive FR water (2% Dychlor produced water), and flushed
w/194 bbls 2% Dychlor water. SD. ISIP 6,419 FG .92 Average rate 35.6
bpm, Average psi 7,771. Shut well in and SDFD. (JD

12/4/09 Fd 4,500 sicp. Well head was froze w/gelled diesel. Pump flush on well
w/breakers and 30 gal 7.5% acid to break up gel. RIH w/ plug and guns.
Set 10k Magnum bridge plug @13,110'. Perf stage-2 Panther f/13,088-
90', break dn perfs w/6,492 @2 bpm. Finish perf f/12,857-59', 13,016-

20', 13,036-38'. POOH. RU to frac. Pump in to perfs w/6,500 @6 bpm.
SD ISIP 6,285 FG .92 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% hcl. Reactive FR frac well
w/6,000# 100 mesh sand, 24,346# 40/70 white sand, 47,750# 40/70 prime
plus, 1,886 bbls Reactive FR water (2% Dychlor produced water), and
flushed w/191 bbls Dychlor water. SD. ISIP 6,191 FG .91 Average rate
39.1 bpm Average psi 7,971. RIH w/plug and guns. Tag something @
7,600' POOH with no problem, @6,400' try to RIH and tag @6,500'.
POOH to 2800' and try to go dn slowly and could not go dn try to come
up and plug moved 100' to 2,700' and plug stuck. Was able to pump .5

bpm around plug but could not move it, tried 1 bpm with no problem, try
1.5 bpm and psi came up to 9,300#. Set plug and POOH. RDMO frac
crew, will have coil tbg on loc in the a.m. to drill out plug then will move
in and continue frac job. SDFD. (JD)

12/5/09 MIRU CUDD coil tbg services. Fd 5,000 sicp. RIH w/3 5/8" 6 blade
mill+ECTD even wall motor+jars+circ sub+disconnect+coil connect.
Holding 5,000 psi tag plug @2,700' mill up and RIH, saw 2,500 psi drop.
Finish RIH tag plug #2 @13,110' and pull up 5' and circulate bottoms
up. Shut well in and pooh. RDMO CUDD coil. SDFD. (JD)

12/6/09 Fd 2,300 sicp. MIRU JW wireline. Lost hydraulics on crane, had to get
crane f/ B&G crane. RIH w/plug and guns. Pinnacle monitoring f/SWF
21-25-9-18. Set 10k weatherford FTFP @12,730', perf stage-3 Spring
canyon f/12,690-98'. POOH. Shut well in and cover w/tarps and heater.
SDFD. (JD)

12/7/09 MIRU superior ws to frac. Pinnacle monitoring job from SWF 21-25-9-18.
Fd 1,875 sicp. Break dn perfs w/4,539 @3 bpm. Pump prepad @30 bpm.
SD, ISIP 3,875 FG .74. During l# stage had to shutdown because of hhp
issues, cut sand and pump 200 bbl sweep. Will continue job in the a.m.
when hhp is rebuilt. Started job w/13,500 hhp, was dn to 4,500 hhp
because of broken radiators, cracked fluid end, and lost packing. Total
pumped, 4,500# 100 mesh sand, 10,289# 18/35 Versa prop, 1,458 bbls
20# XL-BHT, and flushed w/200 bbls 20# lineaer gel. Shut well in and
cover w/tarps and heater. SDFD.
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Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MAN Expires: March 31, 2007

5. al No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REP UTU-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to b.L tottee,or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 31643 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304739729

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Foolage, Sec., T.,R., M., or Survey Description) Riverbend

853' FNL & 2 l 32' FEL I i. County or Parish, State
NWNE of Sec 25-T9S-RI8E Uintah, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposedwork and approximate duration thereof
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequent reports shall be filedwithin 30 days
following completion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthat the site isready forSnalinspection.

This well was started on production on 12/10/2009

RECEiVED
DEC2 4 2009

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MlNING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed 7pped)

Title
Jessica Berg ,. Production Clerk

signature Date
December 23, 2009

HIS P CE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject leas<Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the UnitedStates any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page

Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MAN Expires: March 31, 2007

5. al No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REP UTU-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to b.L tottee,or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 31643 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304739729

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Foolage, Sec., T.,R., M., or Survey Description) Riverbend

853' FNL & 2 l 32' FEL I i. County or Parish, State

NWNE of Sec 25-T9S-RI8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposedwork and approximate duration thereof
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequent reports shall be filedwithin 30 days
following completion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthat the site isready forSnalinspection.

This well was started on production on 12/10/2009

RECEiVED
DEC2 4 2009

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MlNING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed 7pped)

Title
Jessica Berg ,. Production Clerk

signature Date
December 23, 2009

HIS P CE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject leas<Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the UnitedStates any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page



Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED(^Pr"2°°0 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-9803Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Nameabandoned well. Use Fonn 3100-3 (APD) for such proposals. NASUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.1. TypeofWell NA
Oil Well Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator
Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18Gasco Production Company ^PIN EN°3a. Address

3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43047397298 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. FieldandPool,orExploratoryArea4. Location of Well(Footage, Sec., T.,R., M., or SurveyDescription)
Riverbend853' FN L & 2 132' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

NWNE of Sec25-T9S-Rl8E
Uintah, UT12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete OtherOo,.el- O Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

OFinal Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal
13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting date of any proposedwork and approximate duration thercofIf the proposalis to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.Attachthe Bondunda which the work will be performed or provide the BondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowingcompletion of the involved operations. If theopemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form316M shall be filed oncetestinghas beencompleted. Final AbandonmentNoticesshall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have beencompleted, and the operator hasdeterminedthatthesite isready forfinal inspection.

This is to inform you that we will be disposing ofwater from this well as follows:
All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of ateither the Desert Spring State Evaporation Facility (NW 1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E rnUintah County, UT) which is owned by Gasco Production Company or the Eight MileFlat Evaporation Facility (Section 36-T9S-R J8E, Uintah County, UT) which is alsoowned by Gasco Production Co. in the event that Gasco's pits becomefidl we would TItake the water to M & R Oilfield's Commercial waste water disposal NW quarter ofsection 3-T5S-R3W or to Brennan Bottom's disposal site in Roosevelt, Utah.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. \lName (Printed Typed)

Jessica Berg \\ Production Clerk
signature

December 23, 2009
IS S E FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by
Title DateConditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice doesnot warrant oscertify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject leas<Officewhich would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereonTitle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the UnitedStates any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representationsas to any matter within its jurisdiction.(Instructions on page

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED(^Pr"2°°0 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-9803Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Nameabandoned well. Use Fonn 3100-3 (APD) for such proposals. NASUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.1. TypeofWell NA
Oil Well Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator
Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18Gasco Production Company ^PIN EN°3a. Address

3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43047397298 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. FieldandPool,orExploratoryArea4. Location of Well(Footage, Sec., T.,R., M., or SurveyDescription)
Riverbend853' FN L & 2 132' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

NWNE of Sec25-T9S-Rl8E
Uintah, UT12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete OtherOo,.el- O Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

OFinal Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal
13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting date of any proposedwork and approximate duration thercofIf the proposalis to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.Attachthe Bondunda which the work will be performed or provide the BondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowingcompletion of the involved operations. If theopemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form316M shall be filed oncetestinghas beencompleted. Final AbandonmentNoticesshall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have beencompleted, and the operator hasdeterminedthatthesite isready forfinal inspection.

This is to inform you that we will be disposing ofwater from this well as follows:
All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of ateither the Desert Spring State Evaporation Facility (NW 1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E rnUintah County, UT) which is owned by Gasco Production Company or the Eight MileFlat Evaporation Facility (Section 36-T9S-R J8E, Uintah County, UT) which is alsoowned by Gasco Production Co. in the event that Gasco's pits becomefidl we would TItake the water to M & R Oilfield's Commercial waste water disposal NW quarter ofsection 3-T5S-R3W or to Brennan Bottom's disposal site in Roosevelt, Utah.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. \lName (Printed Typed)

Jessica Berg \\ Production Clerk
signature

December 23, 2009
IS S E FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by
Title DateConditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice doesnot warrant oscertify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject leas<Officewhich would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereonTitle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the UnitedStates any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representationsas to any matter within its jurisdiction.(Instructions on page



Form316p UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137
' BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG LeaseSerialNo.
UTU-87586

la. Type of Well O OHWeH ËÊG. LlDry Other 6. If Indian, A11otteeor Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: O New Q Work Over O Deepen Q Plug Back O Diff. Resvr. NA

Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.
NA2. Name of Operator

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Gasco Production CompanV Sheep Wash Federa131-25-9-18
3. Address 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. API Well No.
8 Inverness Drive East Suite 100, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 43-047-39729
4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surface 853' FNL & 2132' FEL NWNW Section 25 T9S RISE Riverbend

I l. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and
At topprod. interval reported below same Survey or Area 25 T9S Rl8E

12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth same Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. te Complete 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

4/1 D & A Ready to Prod.12/03/08 01/17/09 KB: 4,930.3'; GL: 4,904.9'12/10/09
18. Total Depth: MD 13415 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 13307 20. Depth I ridge Plug Set: MD NA

TVD 13415 TVD 13307 Tvo NA
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Was well No O Yes (Submit copy)
Triple Combo, CCL, CBL, CNL, Gyro Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)

Directional O No Yes (Submit copy)
23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in we/I)

Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry VolHole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount PulledDepth Type of Cement (BBL)
24" 16" H-40 65# 0 120 ready mix Cire to Surf

12 1/4" 9 5/8" P-1 47# 0 2313
.795 sx Class G - Circ to Suri12 1/4" 8 5/8" J-5: 32# 2313 3518

7 7/8" 4 1/2 P-111 15.I# 0 13359 715 sx Class G Inside Surf
925 sx 50/50 Poz G

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)
NA

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
Mancos 12857 13219 See Attached

Mesaverde 12690 12698

D)
E)
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material RECEIVEDSee Attached

JAN1 'I 2010

28. Production - Interval A
DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
12/10/09 09/20/09 24 4 0 876 142

Choke TI>g.Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Si Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

14/64 Si no thg 1197 9 0 876 142 Flowing from A & B
28a.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Si FIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

SI

(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse

Form316p UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137
' BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG LeaseSerialNo.
UTU-87586

la. Type of Well O OHWeH ËÊG. LlDry Other 6. If Indian, A11otteeor Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: O New Q Work Over O Deepen Q Plug Back O Diff. Resvr. NA

Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.
NA2. Name of Operator

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Gasco Production CompanV Sheep Wash Federa131-25-9-18
3. Address 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. API Well No.
8 Inverness Drive East Suite 100, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 43-047-39729
4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surface 853' FNL & 2132' FEL NWNW Section 25 T9S RISE Riverbend

I l. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and
At topprod. interval reported below same Survey or Area 25 T9S Rl8E

12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth same Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. te Complete 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

4/1 D & A Ready to Prod.12/03/08 01/17/09 KB: 4,930.3'; GL: 4,904.9'12/10/09
18. Total Depth: MD 13415 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 13307 20. Depth I ridge Plug Set: MD NA

TVD 13415 TVD 13307 Tvo NA
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Was well No O Yes (Submit copy)
Triple Combo, CCL, CBL, CNL, Gyro Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)

Directional O No Yes (Submit copy)
23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in we/I)

Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry VolHole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount PulledDepth Type of Cement (BBL)
24" 16" H-40 65# 0 120 ready mix Cire to Surf

12 1/4" 9 5/8" P-1 47# 0 2313
.795 sx Class G - Circ to Suri12 1/4" 8 5/8" J-5: 32# 2313 3518

7 7/8" 4 1/2 P-111 15.I# 0 13359 715 sx Class G Inside Surf
925 sx 50/50 Poz G

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)
NA

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
Mancos 12857 13219 See Attached

Mesaverde 12690 12698

D)
E)
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material RECEIVEDSee Attached

JAN1 'I 2010

28. Production - Interval A
DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
12/10/09 09/20/09 24 4 0 876 142

Choke TI>g.Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Si Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

14/64 Si no thg 1197 9 0 876 142 Flowing from A & B
28a.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Si FIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

SI

(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse



28b.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size F1wg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production - Interval E
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Solg used forfuel,vented, etc.)

Sold
30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifen): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas. Depth

Wasatch 5,422 9,262
Mesaverde 9,262 12,789
Mancos 12,789 13,415 TD'd within Mancos

32. Additional remarks (include plugging proce, ure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) Afulf Ûµ€ns Title Petroleum Engineer

Signature --- Date

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

O U.S. GPO:

28b.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size F1wg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production - Interval E
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Solg used forfuel,vented, etc.)

Sold
30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifen): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas. Depth

Wasatch 5,422 9,262
Mesaverde 9,262 12,789
Mancos 12,789 13,415 TD'd within Mancos

32. Additional remarks (include plugging proce, ure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) Afulf Ûµ€ns Title Petroleum Engineer

Signature --- Date

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

O U.S. GPO:



Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

27. Perforation Record
Perforated Interval Size Jo. Hole Perf. Status

13175-79; 13193-97; 13215-19 0.38 36 Open
12857-59; 13016-20; 13036-38; 13088-90 0.38 30 Open

12690-98 0.38 48 Open
0.38 Open
0.38 Open
0.38 Open
0.38 Open
0.38 Open

28. Acid Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued)
Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material

Reactive FR frac well w/5,682 # 100 mesh sand, 39,998# 40/70 white sand, 57,914# 40/70 prime plus, 2,559 bbis reactive FR water (2% Dychlor
13175-13219 produced water), and flushed w/194 bbls 2% Dychlor water.

Reactive FR frac well w/6,000# 100 mesh sand, 24,346# 40/70 white sand, 47,750# 40/70 prime plus, 1,886bbls Reactive FR water (2% Dychlor12857-13090 producedwater), and flushed w/191 bb1sDychlor water
12690-12698 Frac well w/ 4,500# 100 mesh, 144,450# 18/35Versaprop, l,458 bbls 20# XL-BHT, and flushed w/200 bbis 20# lineaer

Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

27. Perforation Record
Perforated Interval Size Jo. Hole Perf. Status

13175-79; 13193-97; 13215-19 0.38 36 Open
12857-59; 13016-20; 13036-38; 13088-90 0.38 30 Open

12690-98 0.38 48 Open
0.38 Open
0.38 Open
0.38 Open
0.38 Open
0.38 Open

28. Acid Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued)
Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material

Reactive FR frac well w/5,682 # 100 mesh sand, 39,998# 40/70 white sand, 57,914# 40/70 prime plus, 2,559 bbis reactive FR water (2% Dychlor
13175-13219 produced water), and flushed w/194 bbls 2% Dychlor water.

Reactive FR frac well w/6,000# 100 mesh sand, 24,346# 40/70 white sand, 47,750# 40/70 prime plus, 1,886bbls Reactive FR water (2% Dychlor12857-13090 producedwater), and flushed w/191 bb1sDychlor water
12690-12698 Frac well w/ 4,500# 100 mesh, 144,450# 18/35Versaprop, l,458 bbls 20# XL-BHT, and flushed w/200 bbis 20# lineaer



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GASAND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Gasco Production Co Operator Account Number: N 2575

Address: 8 invemess Drive East, Ste 100

city Englewood

state Co zip 80112 Phone Number: (303) 483-0044

Well 1

,
API Mumber Weli Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4304739730 Sheep Wash Federal 11-25-9-18 NWNW 25 9S 18E Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Nurnber Number Effedtive Date
E 17266 1/15/2009

Comments: Formation Change = MVMCS- p 4 p

Well 2

API Number Well Name O See Twp Rng County
4304739729 Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18 NWNE 25 98 18E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Ennty Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

E 17241 12/3/2008
Comments:

Formation Change = MVMCS

Well 3

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date antityAssignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

RECEIVED
JAN2¡ 2010 gg

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entityfor new well (single gl@Big)\L,GAS&MININGJ¶sica Berg
B - Add new well to existîng entity (groupor unitwell) Na e
C - Re-assign we!Ifrom one existing entity to another existingentity (1
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity sig túre
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Pro etionClerk 1/21/2010

Vitio/ Date

STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GASAND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Gasco Production Co Operator Account Number: N 2575

Address: 8 invemess Drive East, Ste 100

city Englewood

state Co zip 80112 Phone Number: (303) 483-0044

Well 1

,
API Mumber Weli Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4304739730 Sheep Wash Federal 11-25-9-18 NWNW 25 9S 18E Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Nurnber Number Effedtive Date
E 17266 1/15/2009

Comments: Formation Change = MVMCS- p 4 p

Well 2

API Number Well Name O See Twp Rng County
4304739729 Sheep Wash Federal 31-25-9-18 NWNE 25 98 18E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Ennty Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

E 17241 12/3/2008
Comments:

Formation Change = MVMCS

Well 3

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date antityAssignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

RECEIVED
JAN2¡ 2010 gg

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entityfor new well (single gl@Big)\L,GAS&MININGJ¶sica Berg
B - Add new well to existîng entity (groupor unitwell) Na e
C - Re-assign we!Ifrom one existing entity to another existingentity (1
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity sig túre
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Pro etionClerk 1/21/2010

Vitio/ Date



API Well No: 43047397290000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-009803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047397290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0853 FNL 2132 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

1/1/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in addition
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of

water from this well.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/31/2010

December 31, 2010

01/05/2011

iPI Well No: 43047397290000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING LEAs0EO9DEO3GNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047397290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0853 FNL 2132 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,

iPI Well No: 43047397290000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING LEAs0EO9DEO3GNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047397290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0853 FNL 2132 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-009803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047397290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0853 FNL 2132 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

10/27/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: Meter replacement

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The Ferguson Beauregard EFM (model 3500) meter that was originally
installed on this well was replaced with a TotalFlow XSeries (model 6413)

meter. This meter is still considered the point of sale for gas produced from
this well. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected

and proved according to all BLM regulations.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/27/2011

11/10/2011

Oct. 27, 2011

Sundry Number: 19821 API Well Number: 43047397290000Federal Approval of this
Action is Necessary

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEASOE DEO3GNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047397290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 E×t 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0853 FNL 2132 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/27/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Meter replacement

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Ferguson Beauregard EFM (model 3500) meter that was originally
installed on this well was replaced with a TotalFlow XSeries (model 6413)

meter. This meter is still considered the point of sale for gas produced from Accepted by the
this well. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected Utah Division of

and proved according to all BLM regulations. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 11/10/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

Federal Approval of this
Action is Necessary

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEASOE DEO3GNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047397290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 E×t 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0853 FNL 2132 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/27/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Meter replacement

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Ferguson Beauregard EFM (model 3500) meter that was originally
installed on this well was replaced with a TotalFlow XSeries (model 6413)

meter. This meter is still considered the point of sale for gas produced from Accepted by the
this well. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected Utah Division of

and proved according to all BLM regulations. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 11/10/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-009803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047397290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0853 FNL 2132 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

10/27/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: Meter replacement

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The Ferguson Beauregard EFM (model 3500) meter that was originally
installed on this well was replaced with a TotalFlow XSeries (model 6413)

meter. This meter is still considered the point of sale for gas produced from
this well. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected

and proved according to all BLM regulations.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/27/2011

11/10/2011

Oct. 27, 2011

Sundry Number: 19821 API Well Number: 43047397290000Federal Approval of this
Action is Necessary

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEASOE DEO3GNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047397290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 E×t 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0853 FNL 2132 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/27/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Meter replacement

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Ferguson Beauregard EFM (model 3500) meter that was originally
installed on this well was replaced with a TotalFlow XSeries (model 6413)

meter. This meter is still considered the point of sale for gas produced from Accepted by the
this well. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected Utah Division of

and proved according to all BLM regulations. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 11/10/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

Federal Approval of this
Action is Necessary

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEASOE DEO3GNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047397290000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 E×t 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0853 FNL 2132 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/27/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Meter replacement

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The Ferguson Beauregard EFM (model 3500) meter that was originally
installed on this well was replaced with a TotalFlow XSeries (model 6413)

meter. This meter is still considered the point of sale for gas produced from Accepted by the
this well. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected Utah Division of

and proved according to all BLM regulations. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 11/10/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only 

Effective Date· 4/16/2015 
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERA TOR: 
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265 
7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237 
303-996-1805 303-996-1805 

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV 

WELL INFORMATION: 
Well Name API 
See Attached List 

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION: 
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015 
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015 
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143 

REVIEW: 
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: 
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015 
4. OPS/SIITA welles) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1120/2016 
5. VIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A 
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None 
7. Inspections ofPA statelfee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION: 
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 

2. Indian welles) covered by Bond Number: 
3.State/fee welles) covered by Bond Number(s): 

DATA ENTRY: 

1. Welles) update in the OGIS on: 

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 

3. Unites) operator number update in OGIS on: 
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: 
5. StatelFee welles) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION: 

SUR0027842 
N/A 
SUR0027845 
SUR0035619 -FCB 

1122/2016 
1122/2016 
1122/2016 
N/A 
1122/2016 
N/A 

N/A 
6/2/2015 

N/A 

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division 
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1122/2016 
COMMENTS: 

1/22/2016 

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265
7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237
303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUROO27842
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUROO27845

SUROO35619-FCB

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 1/22/2016
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 1/22/2016
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016
COMMENTS:



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

Well Name -
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 

-------
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 
FEDERAL 31-21 G-9-19 
Federal 323-29-9-19 
Federal 421-29-9-19 
Federal 322-29-9-1 9 
Federal 43 1 -29-9-1 9 
Federal 432-29-9-1 9 
Federal 414-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 

.. _--

-----_._- -
federal 321-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 
Federal 212-29-9-19 
State 321-32-9-19 
State 423-32-9-19 
State 421-32-9-19 
State 413-32-9-1 9 
State 323-32-9-1 9 
State 431-32-9-19 ---
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 

-
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-1 0-1 7 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-1 1-16 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 

-----
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 
SQUA W CROSSING U 5 
RBU 5-lID -
FEDERAL 7-25A 

Section 
18 
17 
18 
29 
20 
21 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
36 
36 
36 
30 
29 
23 
26 
19 
17 
21 
32 
20 
17 
19 
32 
4 
32 
29 
16 
16 
29 
8 
16 
20 
20 
4 
22 
24 
2 
11 

------

25 

TWN 'RNG API Number Enti!Y 
090S 190E 4304752496 
090S 190E 4304752522 
090S 190E 4304752538 ' 
090S 190E 4304752544 

. '.' 

090S 190E 4304752545 
090S 190E 4304752546 
090S 190E 4304753026 
090S 190E 4304753027 
090S 190E 4304753029 ; 
090S 190E 4304753030 
090S 190E 4304753031 i 
090S 190E 4304753070 
090S 190E 4304753073 
090S 190E 4304753076 
090S 190E 4304753078 
090S 190E 4304753079 , 
090S 190E 4304753080 
090S 190E 4304753133 1 
090S 190E 4304754479 
090S 190E 4304754480 
090S 190E 4304754481 
090S 190E 4304754482 ! 

090S 190E 4304754483 
090S 190E 4304754529 
090S 180E 4304754541 
090S 180E 4304754542 
090S 180E 4304754543 
090S 190E 4304753012 19650 
100S 170E 4301333098 15941 
090S 190E 4304736915 16556 
090S 180E 4304738573 17201 
090S 190E 4304739777 18344 
O9OS 190E 4304739800 17202 
1I0S 150E 4301332391 13787 
100S 170E 4301332447 14033 
1l0S 150E 4301332475 14417 
100S 170E 4301332560 -14726 
1l0S 160E 4301332611 14439 
100S ,170E 4301332619 15649 
11 OS 170E 4301332674 15537 

' 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 
100S 170E 4301332679 14033 
1I0S 150E 4301332685 16082 
100S 170E 4301332730 15243 
100S 170E 4301332773 15370 
1I0S 170E 4301332778 14802 
1I0S 160E 4301332888 15098 
100S 170E 4301333081 15714 
100S 1 70E '4301333087 i 15807 
11 OS 170E 4301333099 ' 15920 
1I0S 140E 4301333437 16919 
1I0S ,140E 4301333443 16367 
100S 180E 4304730129 16266 
100S ! 180E 4304730409 9005 

I 

090S 180E I4304730624 19030 

Mineral Surface Type Status 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal 'GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 

---
Federal Federal GW APD 
'Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
Federal Federal GW DRL 

--

Federal Federal GW OPS 
Fee Fee GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal ,GW OPS 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P ---
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Eederal GW P 

.. -

Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State 'OW P 
Federal Federal OW P --
Federal Federal OW P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

WellName Section TWN RNGAPINumber Entity Mineral Surface TypeiStatus
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304752522 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752538 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304752544 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304752545 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304752546 Federal Federal OW APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753026 Federal_ Federal GW APD
Federa1421-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753027 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753029 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1431-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753030 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753031 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1414-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753070 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753073 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753076 Federal Federal GW APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753078 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753079 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753080 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753133 Federal Federal GW APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754479 State State GW APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754480 State State GW APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754481 State State GW APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754482 State State GW APD

te 323-32-9-19 32 0908 190E 4304754483 State State GW APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754529 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754541 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754542 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754543 State State GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 1108 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State_ State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-l l-17 4 110S 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-ll-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 l10S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 l10S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW P
RBU 5-11D 11 l00S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU6-2D 
NGC 33-18J 
RBU 13-2D 

2 
18 
2 

-.-------~--~~----~~--

RBU 16-3D 3 
-----

RBU 1O-1lD 11 
RBU 8-10D 10 
RBU 15-3D 3 
RBU 12-12D 12 
RBU2-10D 10 
RBU 3-15D 15 
RBU 3-12D 12 

--

STATE 7-36A 36 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 
STATE4-32B 32 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 
L YTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 

--

FED 11-21-9-19 21 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 

- -

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 

----
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 

-~ ~--

DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 

--
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 

- --_._--

DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 

-
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 

100S 180EI4304731190 7075 State State OW P 
090S 190E:4304731200 16155 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180Ei4304731280 16267 State State OW P 

----

100S 180E 14304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 1180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 

-+-- ---- c----
100S 1180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
100S ~~304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180EI4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 14304731801 110784 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW IP 
090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 14304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734169 14140 'Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734202 113455 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P 
100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170EI4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734607 :13640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E:4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P 

-~ 

090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735405 114928 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW IP 
090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E!4304735623 i 14640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P 
090S 190E4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P 
100S 180E'4304735808 !15592 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 190E 4304735844 114356 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P 
090S 190E 14304736093 i 14976 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P ---f----

090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P 
090S 180E!4304736220 14763 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P +---
090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P 
090S 190E '4304736271 115884 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P 

---
090S 190E !4304736442 .15715 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E ;4304736600 ! 14977 Federal Federal GW P 
090S I 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW ,P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU6i-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State ONV P
14GiC33-18J 18 090S 190E ‡304731200 6155 Federal Federal DNV P
FU3U13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State CA¥ P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
FU3tJ 10-111) 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal ()VV P
FU3t] 8-10L) 10 100S 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal ()?V JP
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU2-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federed Federed Cygr p
IUBU3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federed Federed CA¥ P
FU3U3-12D 12 100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federed Federal OMT P
STATE7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 Sutte Smte GMT P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFLAL23-29#l 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FE]D44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federed (ITV P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FEI342-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GYV P
PETESM'ASH23-12#1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federed Federal GNV P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FEl3 14-18-2 #1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Fedenal Federal GB¥ P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FEI3 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GVV P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFDAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Fedenal Feden11 GMT P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEE)EFLAL41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Feden11 (39V P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P
LikNIB TItUST24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GMT P
FEEIEftAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E =‡304735808 15592 Federal Federal (39V P
FEDERAL21-6-10-19 6 100S 190E 4304735844 14356 Federed Federed GNV P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STitTE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GVV P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEEIEftAL23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 43047369‡42 15715 Federal Federal (svV P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 
-----

FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 
~HEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 -----_ .. _. __ ._--

FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 

--

----------.. -------

----_. __ . __ ._----_._._._._ .... -

FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 
----------

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 

125 090S 180E i4304736727 '15475 Federal Federal 
--

30 090S 190E'4304736739 !15476 Federal Federal 
-------
25 090S 180E'4304736740 15213 Federal Federal 
19 090S 190E 14304736771 

-----

15355 Federal Federal 
-- , -

~L ____ f?90S :180EI4304736772 15338 Federal Federal 
f-----'---+---

30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal 
--

22 090S 190E 14304736913 15187 Fee Fee 
- -- ------- - -- ----f-------

LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E:4304736916 : 17012 Fee Fee --_._----

DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180Ei4304737115 115011 State State 
.... __ .. _._---_.--- -_ .. --------

FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 '090S .190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal 

.--------- -- 1--

UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 14304737132 15087 i State State 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E i4304737338 ! 15365 State State 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E :4304737611 116311 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S i 190E!4304737612 16051 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 119OE[4304737613 16052 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S '190E:4304737621 16253 !Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E I4304737622 16264 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E :4304737630 16557 Federal Federal 
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E

'
4304737631 15961 Federal Federal 

~ 

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 1180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S : 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E !430473767616254 iState State 

----

180E4304737677h5806 State UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S State 
---- c---

UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S ,180E'4304738028 16868 State State 
-- 1-----

FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S ',190E 4304738336 116467 Federal Federal 
1-------

190E 4304738337 116119 IFederal Federal FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S --------------f-----

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E4304738351 16884 Federal Federal 
--- -

180E~4304738352 ~~ WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 16349 Federal Federal _.-----

SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E [4304738353 16210 Federal Federal 
-

FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S : 190E 4304738407 ; 16236 Federal Federal 
--

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E!4304738465 16558 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180EI4304738469 16449 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal 
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S ,190E 4304738673 : 15832 Fee Fee 
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S 180E4304738896 16792 Federal Federal 
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E:4304739170 16309 State State 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S : 190EI4304739171 16308 State State 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 1 190E 4304739172 116310 State State 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E!4304739717 17054 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E,4304739729 17241 Federal Federal -
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 ! 17266 Federal Federal 

. -------. 
4304739773 -: 17013 ,Federal DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E Federal .... -.--_ ..... -

FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E4304740233 17014 Federal Federal 
- - - -

FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E:4304751280 18211 Federal Federal ---------------c------ c---
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190Ei4304751281 18210 Federal Federal 

----f----
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S : 190E 4304752870_1~64? IFederal Federal -------------------r--------- c----

~~~~~~ !;~:~~:~:! ~ 30 090S 190E14304752872 19648 Federal Federal --_ .. __ .. 
30 090S 190E ;4304753011 19649 Federal Federal 

- --1----------
180E 14304753324 '19783 Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S State State 

Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 : 180E 14304753325 36 090S 19783 State State 
--- --

Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S '180E 4304753326 19747 State State 
Desert SI>ring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E '4304753327 119747 State State 

-- _ ... 

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E :4304753328 119783 State State 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S i 170E 4301332677 ! 15144 State State 
RBU 4-11D III 100S 180E :4304730718 16269 Federal Federal 

GW P 
--

GW P 
-~-. 

GW P 
GW P 
GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
----c------
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

--

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

-------

GW ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,P 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW iP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
-----

GW P 
GW P 

----

GW P 
---

OW P 
OW P 
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

- --
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW :S 
OW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-l l-10-18 11 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State_ GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
RBU4-llD ll 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU2-llD 
~---- --
RBU 6-llD 
STATE2-32B c--
STATE 9-36A 
FEDERAL 13-30B 
STATE 13-36A 
FEDERAL 16-26A 

II ._-- -------

II 
32 

1

36 
30 

-----~---

36 
126 

------------------+-----

FEDERAL 31-29 129 
RBU I-IOD :10 ----------------------_.- I 

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 i 18 

100S 180E 4304730826 116270 Federal Federal OW S 
------- ------ 1-------

100S 180E4304731192 16271 .Federal Federal OW S -+---- --
090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 

-090S1180E 4304732225 il1364 
---

State State IGW S 
090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
090S il80E 4304733598 17838 State State IGW S 
090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
090S ! 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
100S 1180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW .S 
090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal iGW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-l lD 11 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S
STATE 2-32B 32 '090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE 9-36A 36 _ _090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significanUy deepen existing wells below current boItom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drlH horizontal laterals. Use APPLlCA TION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for sUCh proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OILWELL 0 GAS WELL IlJ OTHER __________ _ 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Gasco Production Company 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

7979 E. Tufts Ave. 

4. LOCATIONOFWELL 

CITY Denver 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL 

STATE CO zIP80237 

QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWJIISHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S 

I PHONE NUMBER: 

(303) 483-0044 

UTU-76482 
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UMT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18 
9. API NUMBER: 

4304737631 
10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: 

Uteland Butte 

COUNTY: Uintah 

STATE: 
UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

rlI 0 ACIDIZE 0 DEEPEN 0 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(SubmH in Duplicate) 0 ALTER CASING 0 FRACTURE TREAT 0 SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work wil start: 0 CASING REPAIR 0 NEW CONSTRUCTION 0 TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

4/16/2015 0 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE 0 TUBING REPAIR 

0 CHANGE TUBING 0 PLUG AND ABANDON 0 VENT OR FLARE 

0 SUBSEQUENT REPORT 0 CHANGE WELL NAME 0 PLUG BACK 0 WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

0 CHANGE WELL STATUS 0 PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) 0 WATER SHUT-OFF 
Date of work completion: 

0 COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS 0 RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 0 OTHER: 

0 CONVERT WELL TYPE 0 RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator 01:1 this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco 
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/1612015. 

Gasco Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

Badlands Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui ~ 15 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

(512000) 

TITLE 

DATE 

(See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

RECEIVED 
JUN 0 2 2015 

DIV OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

Engineering Tech 

511812015 

APPROVE 
JAN 22 2016 

~.oIL_ GAS & MINING ... 

BY:~Ch.Jt9 rn~cLU'\~ 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-76482

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill newwells,significantlydeepen exislingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TODRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL O GASWELL OTHER Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

7979 E. Tufts Ave CITY
Denver STATE CO ZIP 80237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL COUNTY: Uintah

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FR^CTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

4/16/2015 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUGAND ABANDON O VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME O PLUGBACK O WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) O WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE O OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly show allpertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on thiswell, in additionto thewells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effectivedate of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 1
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

Michael Decker, Exec. Vi President & COO !)EC61VEL
Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui 15 JUN0 2 205
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

DIVOFOiL,GAS&MINING
Michael Decker, Exec. Vic PreWent&COO

NAME (PLEASE PRIN Lindsey Cooke TITLE Engineering Tech

SIGNATURE DATE 5/18/2015

(Thisspacefo Stateuseonly) APPROVED
JAN2 2 2016

(5/2000) (seeinstruolinsonReverseSide) IV.OlL GAS &



Well Name Section TWN RNO API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal OW DRL 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal OW OPS 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 O9OS 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee OW OPS 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S lSOE 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal OW OPS 
OATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 II OS 150E 4301332391 13787 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332447 14033 State State OW P 
OATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 II OS 150E 4301332475 14417 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 lOOS 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 II OS 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332619 15649 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 4 llOS 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332676 15242 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 lOOS l70E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 llOS 150E 4301332685 16082 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 lOOS 170E 4301332730 15243 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 llOS l70E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 llOS 160E 4301332888 15098 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333087 15S07 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 II OS 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 II OS 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 II OS 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 5-IID II lOOS 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 O9OS 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU6-2D 2 lOOS 180E 430473ll9O 7075 State State OW P 
NOC33-18J 18 O9OS 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 13-20 2 lOOS 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P 
RBU 16-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU IO-IID II lOOS 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU8-IOD 10 l00s 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 15-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 12-120 12 lOOS lSOE 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU2-IOD 10 lOOS 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-15D 15 lOOS 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-12D 12 lOOS 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE7-36A 36 O9OS 180E 4304733741 14244 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 lOOS 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734ll1 13441 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 O9OS 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 O9OS 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal OW P 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 lOOS 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE4-32B 32 O9OS 190E 4304734314 14440 State State OW P 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 lOOS 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 lOOS l70E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal OW P 
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 lOOS lSOE 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 O9OS 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal OW P 

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKINRIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 1005 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 0905 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 1908 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED l2-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE 32-08 8 110S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
RBU5-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 6-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State OW P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P
RBU 16-3D 3 1005 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 8-10D 10 1005 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 1005 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 2-l0D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-12D 12 1005 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 0905 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 0908 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal GW P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GW P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 4-32B 32 0908 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FED 14-18-2#1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FED I 1-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 0905 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW



FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee OW P 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 lOOS 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 lOOS 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 41-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304735845 14639 State State OW P 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 O9OS 190E 4304735995 14871 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 23-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736219 14738 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 21-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736220 14763 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 12-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736233 14764 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 43-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736241 14992 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 O9OS 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 33-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304737115 15011 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 O9OS 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737132 15087 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737338 15365 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO FED 21-1-10-18 I l00s 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 I lOOS 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737676 16254 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737677 15806 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304738028 16868 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal OW P 

FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 0908 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 0903 190E 4304735732 144% Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 0908 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 1005 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 0908 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 0905 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 0905 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 0905 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 0905 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 1005 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 0905 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW



LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P 
UTELAND FED 42-1 1-10-18 II 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P 
STATE21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 Slale Stale GW P 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 Slale State GW P 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P 
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P 
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P 
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State Stale GW P 
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 Slate Slale GW P 
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P 
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P 
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 Slale Stale GW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S 
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 Slale Slale OW S 
RBU 4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU2-11D II 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S 
STATE 2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 Slale State GW S 
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S 
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
RBU 1-100 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S 
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW S 

LAMBTRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 1005 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 0905 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 43047397\7 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED I 1-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 I 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert SpringsState 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
DesertSpring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
SQUAW CROSSING US 2 1005 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW S
RBU4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Fedem! Fedeml ONV S
RBU2-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304730826 16270 Fedeml Fedeml CAV S
RBU6-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304731192 16271 Fedem! Fedeml OAV S
STATE2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 0905 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW
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