14421 County Rd. 10 « Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621 = (303) 857-9999 « FAX (303) 857-0577 » E-MAIL Permitco 1@aol.com

March 19, 2007

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
Attn: Minerals
Re: Gasco Production Company
State #21-32B
1300' FNL and 1880' FWL
NE NW Section 32, T9S - R19E
Uintah County, Utah
Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find one copy of the Application for Permit to Drill, along with the required
attachments.

Please note that this location was staked at non-standard spacing in accordance with the rules and
regulations of the Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining. This was done for geologic considerations. Please also
note that Gasco Production Company and Brek Petroleum, Inc. are the only working interest owners within a
460 foot radius. A letter from Brek accepting this location will be submitted under separate cover. Therefore,
we request your administrative approval of this exception to spacing.

If you should need additional information, please don’t hesitate to contact me.
Sincerely,

PERMITCO INC,

Venessa Langmacher
Consultant for
Gasco Production Company

Enc.

cc: Gasco Production Company - Englewood, CO
Shawn Elworthy - Roosevelt, UT RECEIVE D
Shon McKinnon - Altamont, UT MA
Utah Division of State Lands - SLC, UT R 22 2007

Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining - Roosevelt, UT
g DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 3

AMENDED REPORT [
(highlight changes)

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL EADA R R
P 10 ML-45172 State
1A, TYPE OF WORK: DRILL m REENTER D DEEPEN D 7. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
N/A
B TyrEoFwel OL[J GAS[X]  OTHER SINGLE ZONE [] MULTIPLE ZONE [X] | & UNIT or CAAGREEMENT NAME:
N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company State #21-32B
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: u[‘tb
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100, Englewood, CO 80112 303/483-0044 bl (Sencio
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOO(;AOG!iS)qz 9 x “ 39 ’ mcg ?{ 1. h;)E;ﬁ)leA;;R' SECTIO'J, TOWNSHIP, RANGE
AT SURFACE: 7 300' FNL and 1880' FWL . i
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE' | 17 NE NW - DC) ) g 0 {qg Vs Section 32, T9S - R19E
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
Approximately 27.2 miles southeast of Myton, UT Uintah Ut
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
1300' 476.29 40 Acres: NE NW

18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET):

19. PROPOSED DEPTH:

20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

Approx. 1400' 11,830' Statewide Bond No. 4127763
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23, ESTIMATED DURATION:
4756' GL ASAP 35 Days
2. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT | SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
17-1/2" 13-3/8", H-40, 48# 200' 200 sx Premium Type 5, 15.6 ppg, 1.18 yield
12-1/4" 8-5/8", J-55, 32# 3,228' | 527 sx Hi-Lift @ 11.0 ppg, 3.91 yield & 185 sx 10-2 RFC @ 14.2 ppg, 1.63 yield
7-7/8" 4-1/2", P-110, 13.5# 11,830' |366 sx Hi-Lift @ 11.5 ppg, 3.05 yield & 1049 sx 50/50 Poz @ 14.1 ppg, 1.28 yielc

25.

ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER

EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER

COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN

D FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

AGENT: PermitCo Inc.
Lisa Smith

AGENT'S PHONE NO.: 303/857-9999

Agent for Gasco Production Company

NAME (PLEASE PRINT
SIGNATUR

————————

(This space for State use only)

AP| NUMBER ASSIGNED:

43-0471-39 ( 70

Utah Division of

(11/2001)

‘.~

Qil, Gersead Mining

A\

L Z, : TITLE
WM/ oare  March 19, 2007
Approved by the

RECEIVED

MRZZw

Div. of OIL, Gas & MINING
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Application for Permit to Drill
Statement of Basis

5/7/2007 Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Page 1
APD No API WellNo Status Well Type Surf Ownr CBM
398 43-047-39170-00-00 GW S No
Operator GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY Surface Owner-APD

Well Name STATE 21-32B Unit

Field PARIETTE BENCH Type of Work

Location NENW 32 9S 19E S 1300 FNL 1880 FWL GPS Coord (UTM) 601938E 4427229N
Geologic Statement of Basis

Gasco has proposed 200’ of surface casing and 3,228’ of intermediate casing at the proposed location. Both are
to be cemented to surface. The base of the moderately saline water is estimated to at 2,900 feet. A search of
Division of Water Rights records shows no water wells within a 10,000’ radius of the proposed location. The
surface formation at this location is the Uinta Formation. The Uinta Formation is comprised of interbedded
sandstones and shales is likely to contain limited aquifers. The proposed casing and cementing program should
adequately protect any useable sources of ground water,

Brad Hill 5/7/2007
APD Evaluator Date / Time

Surface Statement of Basis

The location is approximately 25 miles straight-line distance southeast of Roosevelt, UT and 27.4 road miles
southeast of Myton, UT.

Access to the site is by State and County highways or roads and oilfield development roads. All existing roads
are suitable for access. 0.35 miles of new road will be constructed to the location.

The general area is known as Sheep Wash. Topography is relative flat benches often broken with gently but
sometimes steep draws. Sheep Wash drains into the Green River approximately 1-% miles to the southeast of
the proposed location. All drainages are ephemeral with no know springs or seeps in the immediate area.

This specific location is proposed to be a 3-well pad. On the west it begins on the slope of a hill or ridge then
extends east on a gentle bench. A swale begins near the center and runs east into Sheep Wash. Also a draw
begins outside the southwest corner at corner 2. To avoid this draw, which becomes steep, this corner will be
rounded. An access road is planned onto the location and also into the bottom of Sheep Wash beginning near
this corner. Fill from the location will catch on the access road leading to the bottom of the wash. This road
will require cutting of the side and fill to reach the bottom of the wash. The location when corner 2 is rounded
is a suitable site for drilling and operating the proposed wells. The road leading into the bottom is not a good
place to construct a road but will not affect this location.

Both the surface and the minerals are owned by S.LT.L.A.

Ed Bonner representing SITLA had no concerns regarding the location as planned and approved of the road into
the bottom south of the location.

The pre-drill investigation of the surface was performed on April 25,2007 Both the surface and the minerals
are owned by S.LT.L.A. Edward Bonner of S.LT.L.A and Ben Williams of UDWR were notified and invited to

participate in this pre-site. Mr. Bonner attended.

This appears to be the best location for drilling and operating wells in the general area.



CONFIDENTIAL TIGHT-HOLE

State #21-32B
1300' FNL and 1880' FWL
NE NW Section 32, T9S - R19E
Uintah County, Utah

Prepared For:

Gasco Production Company

By:

PERMITCO INC.
14421 County Road 10
Fort Lupton, CO 80621

303/857-9999

Copies Sent To:

1- Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining - SLC, UT

1- Utah Division of State Lands - SLC, UT

1- Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining - Roosevelt, UT
2 - Gasco Production Company - Englewood, CO

1- Shawn Elworthy - Roosevelt, UT

1 - Shon McKinnon - Altamont, UT




Application for Permit to Dri, ) lONFIDENTIAL TIGHT-HOLE
Gasco Production Company

State #21-32B ML-45172
1300' FNL and 1880' FWL

NE NW Section 32, T9S - R19E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 1

The proposed wellsite is located on State Surface/State Minerals.
1. Estimated Tops/Geologic Markers

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth Subsea
Wasatch 5,010’ -260'
Mesaverde 8,775 -4,025'
Castlegate 11,210’ -6,460'
Blackhawk 11,460’ -6,710'
Sunnyside 11,680' -6,930'
T.D. 11,830' -7,080'

2. Estimated Depths and Names of Anticipated Water, Oil, Gas or Other Minerals Bearing

Formations.
Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 5,100'-8,775'
Gas Mesaverde 8,775'-11,210'
Gas Blackhawk 11,460'-11,800'
3. Well Control Equipment & Testing Procedures

Gasco Production Company's minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are as follows:

Ram Type: 11" Hydraulic double, 5000 psi w.p. with annular




Application for Permit to Dri. ) ):ONFIDENTIAL TIGHT-HOLE
Gasco Production Company

State #21-32B ML-45172
1300' FNL and 1880' FWL

NE NW Section 32, T9S - R19E ‘ DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 2

Gasco will comply will all requirements pertaining to well control as listed in the Rule R649-3-7 of the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining.

The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram.

4. Casing Program

The proposed casing program will be as follows:

Purpose Depth Hole Size | 0.D. Weight | Grade | Type | New/Used
Conductor 0-200' 17-12" | 13-3/8" 48# H-40 New
Surface 0-3,228' 12-1/4" 8-5/8" 324 J-55 ST&C New
Production 0-11,830' 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 | LT&C New

Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.

5. Cement Program

Conductor Type and Amount

TOC @ Surface 200 sx Premium Type 5, 15.6 ppg, 1.18 yield

Surface Type and Amount

TOC @ Surface Lead: 527 Hi-Lift, 11 ppg, 3.91 yield
Tail: 185 sx 10-2 RFC, 14.2 ppg, 1.63 yield

Production Type and Amount

TOC @ 2500’ Lead: 366 sx Hi-Lift, 11.5 ppg, 3.05 yield.
Tail: 1049 sx 50/50 Poz @ 14.1 Ppg, 1.28 yield.




Application for Permit to Dri”j wFONFIDENTIAL TIGHT-HOLE
Gasco Production Company

State #21-32B ML-45172
1300' FNL and 1880' FWL

NE NW Section 32, T9S - R19E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 3

6. Drilling Fluids

The proposed circulating mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:

Interval Mud Type Mud Wt Visc. F/L PH

0-200' Fresh Water 8.33 1 7
200' - 3,228' Fresh Water 8.33 1 7-8
3,228'-TD | FreshWater & DAP | 9.0-115 | 30-40 | 12-20 8

7. Testing, Logging and Coring
The anticipated type and amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:
a. No drill stem tests are anticipated.

b. The logging program will consist of an Induction or Laterolog as appropriate, Gamma Ray,
Neutron and Density to be run from TD to Base of Surface Casing.

C. No cores are anticipated.
8. Anticipated Pressures and H,S
a. No H,S is expected. The maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure is 6625 psi. The

maximum bottom hole temperature is 201 degrees Fahrenheit.

9. Water Source

a. All water used for the drilling of this well will be purchased the Nebeker Water Station in
Myton, UT. Permit No. 43-1721.




Application for Permit to Dri i;ONFIDENTIAL TIGHT-HOLE
Gasco Production Company

State #21-32B ML-45172
1300' FNL and 1880' FWL

NE NW Section 32, T9S - R19E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 4

10. Other Information

a. Drilling is planned to commence immediately upon approval of this application.

b. It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately 35 days.

c. Lining of the reserve pit will be done if deemed necessary by the Utah Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining.

d. Atthe end of drilling operations the location will be reclaimed and re-seeded as requested by
the State of Utah.

e. Surface Ownership
State of Utah

f. An archeological survey will be conducted by Grand River Institute and the report will be

submitted directly by Grand River Institute.
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GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
STATE #22-32A, #21-32B, & #21-32A

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 32, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.
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PHOTO

435-789-1017  uels@uelsinc.com TAKEN BY: LW. | DRAWN BY: L.

K. JREVISED: 00-00-00

—~ Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying
I - Siee 1964 - ]qs




&
£

N 24.3 ML, +/-)

o

PROPOSED ACCESS 0. 3 MI +/- V. = . A pnoposeng CESS Foﬂ
“#41-319-19¢ V=N b TS THE #4232 0.4 MI. +/-

015Ml +/- [~

0y Pl ﬂ 1;|~_-JLD“2'32919
3 N #12:32,48 q 50 & :
g > ® PROPOSED LOOP 1 < ‘ i . PROPOSED LOCATION:
QETIXTATRIN [ (STATE #22-32A, #21-32B & 21-32A }

_ N .
(“AG( 0 PRODUCTION (0'\1[’ANY
________________ PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD N STATE #22-32A, #21-32B & #21-32A
EXISTING ROAD SECTION 32, 19S, RI19E, S.L.B.&M.
NE 1/4 NW 1/4

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGRAPHIC Ol 16|07
HS Soush 200 axe Vermal; Utan wio7n M A P v | vean
SCALE: 1" =2000'] DRAWN B\:I-.h. ]RE\ISED.(] 14-07




Am QF £

i ™ \ P

| ‘J/C:/} I{I 4]

L o g it

,/_/ Z S ‘ ._

O - ,_( = ,{::I’\
T9SJ..\Y,

ATI0S)

o . Tr
= r\}ﬂ’xag:?ﬁ*"- A

)
-ll'/\'l"'\_ L’F/E:> . r/'-)J' f N 0 Ilil X

{ PROPOSED LOCATION:

i "._."H
& 21-32AE

|STATE #22-32A, #21-32B

a

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

2 DISPOSAL WELLS
@ PRODUCING WELLS

@ SHUT IN WELLS

@ WATER WELLS
# ABANDONED WELLS
-@ TEMPORARILY ABANDONED

STATE #22-32A, #21-32B & #21-32A
SECTION 32, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.

NE 1/4 NW 1/4

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah B4078
(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

|

TOPOGRAPHIC
MAP

01

MoNTH

16

DAY

07

YEAR

SCALE: 1"=2000' DRAWN BY: L.K. |REVISED: 00-00-00;

| TorPO
|




PROP
! I
PROPOSED |

LN

[2%4

o) -l

A

PROPOSED LOCATION:

\

= % Aoy

]
\j) S'rQLE #22-32A, #21-323f& 21-32A L/
// \//—S \ (?:/r—/ \\EL‘\
" 7}

/e
TN

£
M

- =

APPROXIMATE TOTAL PI

PELINE DISTANCE

1.600' +/-

LEGEND:

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD
EXISTING PIPELINE
PROPOSED PIPELINE

STATE #22-32A, #21-32B & #21-32A
SECTION 32, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.
NE 1/4 NW 1/4

Uintah Engineering & I.and Surveying

BS South 200 East
(3435) 789-1017 * IFAX (435) 789-1813

Vernal, Utah 84078

TOPOGRAPHIC

01

MONTH

16

DAY

07

YEAR

SCALE: 1"=1000'] DRAWN BY: LK, |[REVISED: (

13-14-07




)ASCO PRODUCTION COMPA,,’{
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR Approx.
Toe of
STATE #22—-32A, #21-32B & #21—-32A Fill Slope
2
SECTION 32, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. ,;‘—42@,0
NE 1/4 NW 1/4 K i
’ . . ; : R ,"‘ . 9
F—=10.7" (< o lcﬂ
£l 436’ r 65 @ Sto. 4+00 7
, _
SCALE: 1" = 50’ 5‘5%94
DATE: 1-17-07 ’ i
Drawn By: K.G.
= -
S S
o~
2
2 S
Approx.
Top of 1 P %
Cut Slope :x(‘ .‘?é" g‘
z = =
8 E §
: - — |||+ ; 1 EX 3
, . _ ’ )
El. 47.8 'Z‘/’.Zfe ggf Cet 0’
’ ’ —1. PIPE RACKS
=135 6 D& 555
(btm. pit) @ 80 20° . | | I )
I I T 1 r T T 1
100° C— 73,
[ e Il £ 556°
ik 7
— e Vs DOG_HOUSE
| Sta. 2+00
45’ o) P 135’
ey ) sSiNc—-17.9 21
RESERVE PIT "B (?’ﬂ 562 F=10.3
(10’ Deep) ~1c-39 & £l 44.0
N .
Total Pit Capacity ”_F_ £ 282 § J \ » o
W ~_ ’ o~ ] L
28] Yhieaw o | POl 4| C=2.2 3
~ 197~ rotal Pit Votume . X — V£l 56.5 &
2 T = 4,280 Cu. Yds. - = (S
G Q O = MUD SHED
O X = — g
@ § s = TOILET []
T v W | HopPER
o2 2
S E [ rover ’
2w o TRASH 2
T % o I [ 1] o -
Slope = 1-1/2:1 E:l FUEL
L I I I
Total Pit Copacit _‘8_ RESERVE PIT "A°
o / apact | —] s ’
W3 of Freeboard (10" Deep) k. 677 | Sto. 0+50
= 3810 Bbls. + T C—13 4 N - T STORAGE
Total Pit Vol , 0
=150 cu Vs 100, ﬁA © ) TANK Q
' 10’ WIDE BENCH /DIKE c=-17.7
ﬂ £ 720 52“,@:65:;"”5 F—40.0°
£. 56.5° ’\ 0 @ £l 14.3
c-12.2 , Sta._0+00 ngl
(btm. pit) C—-17.7 4
&L 720 v Proposed Access
' 4755.6° oo
Elev. Ungraded Ground at Location Stoke = -0 UINTAH ENCINEERINC & LAND SURVEYINC
Elev. Graded Ground ot lLocation Stoke = 47543 85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (801) 789—1017




JASCO PRODUCTION COMPs X
TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR

20" °

|| X—Section STATE #22-32A, #21-32B & #21—32A
.| Sede SECTION 32, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.
1” = 50° NE 1/4 NW 1/4

DATE: 1-17-07
Drawn By: K.G.

| 65’ 135’

} Finished Grode

- - —— )
AL FILL st e e T AL ON Rt
N
STA. 4+00 SN
\\
45’ 135’
LOCATION STAKE
—_ \/ 1121
=== === \ )
|’ STA. 2+00
T =TT T T T T =T I | |-— | .
T == =TT
10, | 100' 45’ 1\35,
I - —_—
g e ~— —_
W — —_
[\ _— ~—
— FILL
L A T T e e T T T T
= = \
T — \
= cuT —
R e e S  p g e |1’ STA. 0+50
T T T TP T =T TR T \
Preconstruction T —
Grade \/ — 45 i \
/
— \
R T T T T A A\__““\
NOTE: =HEEEEEEEEEL \
Topsoil should not be \ \
Stripped Below Finished
Grade on Substructure Area. STA. 0+00 \ \\
* NOTE: \
FILL QUANTITY INCLUD
APPROXIMATE YARDAGES (L QUANTITY JNCLUDES \ \
cuT ~ \
EXCESS MATERIAL = 70,070 Cu. Yds.
(8") Topsoil Stripping = 2,310 Cu. Yds. ) _ ~
Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 2,710 Cu. Yds.
Remaining Location = 16,440 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)
EXCESS UNBALANCE = 7360 Cu. Yds.
TOTAL CUT = 18,750 CU.YDS. (After Interim Rehabilitation)
FILL = 8680 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (801) 789-1017
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WORKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 03/22/2007

WELI. NAME: STATE 21-32B
OPERATOR: GASCO PRODUCTION ( N2575 )
CONTACT: LISA SMITH
PROPOSED LOCATION:
NENW 32 0908 190E
SURFACE: 1300 FNL 1880 FWL
BOTTOM: 1300 FNL 1880 FWL
COUNTY: UINTAH
LATITUDE: 39.99099 LONGITUDE: -109.8060

UTM SURF EASTINGS: 601938 NORTHINGS: 4427229

FIELD NAME: PARIETTE BENCH ( 640 )
LEASE TYPE: 3 - State
LEASE NUMBER: ML-45172
SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State

API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-39170

PHONE NUMBER: 303-857-9999

INSPECT LOCATN BY: /

Date

6/2702

Initials

)z

Tech Review

Engineering

Geology

Surface

PROPOSED FORMATION:
COALBED METHANE WELL?

BLKHK
NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED:

s

N Plat

Bond: Fed[] Ind[] Stal{] Feell
(No. 04127763 )

Potash (Y/N)

0il shale 190-5

Water Permit
(No. 43-1721

(B) or 190-3 or 190-13

EE [ REF N

RDCC Review (Y/N)

(Date: )
Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N)
Intent to Commingle (Y/N)

LOCATION AND SITING:
R649-2-3.

Unit:

R649-3-2.
Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

\l R649-3-3. Exception

General

Drilling Unit
Board Cause No:

Eff Date:
Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS :

Ao, d Ll?d o b (0U4-756)

STIPULATIONS:

- \Seacinp SSH

Y

9 -

"T‘(\A)*KWLFMJT_ (el %&5{ S




T9S RI19E

STATE 4-32B

)
FIDIRAL 4131919 STl 45245

STATE 12-32:9-19

HEDERAL 34249

HHI
2133
(-

/
[ STATE 21324
@STATE 22324
T STATE 20-32B
\
\
I|
|

BHL
22-32A

31

PARIETTE BENCH FIELD

T10S R19E

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD

FED 44-29-9-19
FED 13-28-9-19
FED 14-28-9-19

N
N

STATE 2328

SEATE 42-32-9-19
e

€

OPERATOR: GASCO PROD CO  (N2575)
SEC: 32 T9S R.19E

FIELD: PARIETTE BENCH (640)
COUNTY: UINTAH

SPACING: R649-3-3 / EXCEPTION LOCATION

Wells Status

GAS INJECTION

GAS STORAGE
LOCATION ABANDONED
NEW LOCATION
PLUGGED & ABANDONED

PRODUCING GAS
PRODUCING OIL
SHUT-IN GAS
SHUT-IN OIL

TEMP. ABANDONED
TEST WELL

WATER INJECTION
WATER SUPPLY

Field Status Uni IES;E;?:S iR
] ABANDONED GAS STORAGE
[ ACTIVE NEF PP OIL
COMBINED NF SECONDARY
[ INACTIVE PENDING
~ PROPOSED E g::?;lks
= B2kl S PP GEOTHERML
(] [ PPOIL
[—] SECONDARY
™ TERMINATED

WATER DISPOSAL
DRILLING

-‘%-@Do)x(oikoﬁ¢®><

¥ ¥ o
' 4

—N—

AN —
Utah Oil Gas and Mining
N
W E
S

PREPARED BY: DIANA MASON
DATE: 29-MARCH-2007




Application for Permit to Drill
Statement of Basis

5/7/2007 Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Floyd Bartlett 4/25/2007
Onsite Evaluator Date / Time

Conditions of Approval / Application for Permit to Drill

Category
Pits

Condition

A double synthetic liner each with a minimum thickness of 16 mils with a felt subliner
shall be properly installed and maintained in the reserve pit.



-,
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ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUATIUN
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Operator GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

Well Name STATE 21-32B

API Number 43-047-39170-0 APD No 398 Field/Unit PARIETTE BENCH
Location: 1/4,1/4 NENW Sec 32 Tw 9S8 Rng 19E 1300 FNL 1880 FWL

GPS Coord (UTM) 601912 4427245 Surface Owner

Participants
Floyd Bartlett (DOGM), Shon Mckinnon (Permit Agent for GASCO), Edward Bonner (SITLA),

Regional/Local Setting & Topography

The location is approximately 25 miles straight-line distance southeast of Roosevelt, UT and 27.4 road miles southeast of

Myton, UT.

Access to the site is by State and County highways or roads and oilfield development roads. All existing roads are suitable

for access. 0.35 miles of new road will be constructed to the location.

The general area is known as Sheep Wash. Topography is relative flat benches often broken with gently but sometimes
steep draws. Sheep Wash drains into the Green River approximately 1-/2 miles to the southeast of the proposed location.

All drainages are ephemeral with no know springs or seeps in the immediate area.

This specific location is proposed to be a 3-well pad. On the west it begins on the slope of a hill or ridge then extends east

on a gentle bench. A swale begins near the center and runs east into Sheep Wash. Also a draw begins outside the
southwest corner at corner 2. To avoid this draw, which becomes steep, this corner will be rounded. An access road is
planned onto the location and also into the bottom of Sheep Wash beginning near this corer. Fill from the location will
catch on the access road leading to the bottom of the wash. This road will require cutting of the side and fiil to reach the

bottom of the wash. The location when corner 2 is rounded is a suitable site for drilling and operating the proposed wells.

The road leading into the bottom is not a good place to construct a road but will not affect this location.

Both the surface and the minerals are owned by S.LT.L.A.

Surface Use Plan
Current Surface Use

Grazing
Wildlfe Habitat
New Road
Miles Well Pad Src Const Material Surface Formation
0.35 Width 290 Length 385 Onsite UNTA

Ancillary Facilities N

Waste Management Plan Adequate? Y

Environmental Parameters
Affected Floodplains and/or Wetland N

Flora / Fauna

Gardner saltbrush, shadscale, curly mesquite, cheatgrqass, broom snakeweed, bud sage, Mormon tea, lomatium,

spring annuals and greasewood;

5/7/2007

Page 1



Deer, elk, antelope, songbiius, chuckars, rodent, raptors, coyote, bobcats, catuc in the winter.

Soil Type and Characteristics
Shalow rocky clayey sandy loam

Erosion Issues N
Sedimentation Issues N

Site Stability Issues N
Drainage Diverson Required N

Berm Required? N

Erosion Sedimentation Control Required? N

Paleo Survey Run? Paleo Potental Observed? N

Reserve Pit

Site-Specific Factors
Distance to Groundwater (feet)
Distance to Surface Water (feet)
Dist. Nearest Municipal Well (ft)
Distance to Other Wells (feet)
Native Soil Type
Fluid Type
Drill Cuttings
Annual Precipitation (inches)
Affected Populations
Presence Nearby Utility Conduits

Characteristics / Requirements

>200

>1000

>5280

<300

Mod permeability
Fresh Water
Normal Rock

<10

<10

Not Present

Cultural Survey Run? Y  Cultural Resources? N

Site Ranking
0

0

0

20

10

O O O O W

Final Score 35

1 Sensitivity Level

100’ by 200° located within a cut area on the on the northwest side of the location. It is 10 feet deep with a 10-foot
wide bench. Stability should not be a problem. With the location situated on a bench part way down the slope then
breaking sharply into Sheep wash and being only 1-1/2 miles from the Green River a double 16 mil liner is

recommended. This was agreeable with Shon Mckinnon representing Gasco.

Closed Loop Mud Required? N Liner Required? Y Liner Thickness 16

Other Observations / Comments

Floyd Bartlett
Evaluator

5/7/2007

4/25/2007
Date / Time

Pit Underlayment Required? Y

Page 2
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Well name: 2007-05 Gasco State 21-32B

Operator: Gasco Production Company

String type:  Surface Project iD:
43-047-39170

Location: Uintah County

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors:

Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.330 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 78 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 200 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 25 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 176 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psifft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 200 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 3,228 ft
Tension is based on buoyed weight.  Next mud weight: 8.330 ppg
Neutral point: 176 ft Next setting BHP: 1,397 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 200 ft
Injection pressure: 200 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) () (f) (in) (')

1 200 13.375 48.00 H-40 ST&C 200 200 12.59 176.3
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

{psi) (psi) Factor {psi) {psi) Factor (Kips) {Kips) Factor

1 87 740 8.555 200 1730 8.65 8 322 38.22J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801-538-5357 Date: May 16,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 200 ft, a mud weight of 8.33 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.
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Well name: 2007-05 Gasco State 21-32B
Operator: Gasco Production Company
String type:  Intermediate Project ID:
43-047-39170
Location: Uintah County
Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.330 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 120 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 200 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 2,518 psi
Internal gradient: 0.220 psifft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,228 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 11,830 ft
Tension is based on buoyed weight.  Next mud weight: 11.500 ppg
Neutral point: 2,829 ft Next setting BHP: 7,067 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 3,228 ft
Injection pressure: 3,228 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
() (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft)

1 3228 8.625 32.00 J-55 ST&C 3228 3228 7.875 1104.6
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load  Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

{psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 1397 2530 1.811 3228 3930 1.22 91 372 411 J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801-538-5357 Date: May 16,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 3228 ft, a mud weight of 8.33 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.
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Well name: 2007-05 Gasco State 21-32B

Operator: Gasco Production Company

String type:  Production Project ID:
43-047-39170

Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 11.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 241 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 3,995 ft

Burst

Max anticipated surface
pressure: 4,465 psi
Internal gradient: 0.220 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 7,067 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)
Tension is based on buoyed weight.
Neutral point: 9,822 ft
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) () () (in) (ft))

1 11830 45 13.50 P-110 LT&C 11830 11830 3.795 991.5
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load  Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

{psi) {psi) Factor {psi) (psi) Factor {Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 7067 10680 1.511 7067 12410 1.76 133 338 255J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801-5638-5357 Date: May 16,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 11830 ft, a mud weight of 11.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.
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GASGO g 39170
Energy oot

March 28, 2007

Brek Petroleum, Inc.
Sulte 600 - 1100 Melville Street
Vancouver, BC VGE 4A6

Attn: Anne McFadden
Re: Gasco Production Company
State #21-32B
Uintah County, Utah
Riverbend Field
Wasatch, Mesaverde and Blackhawk

Dear Anne,

Please be advised that Gasco Production Company proposes to stralght-hole drill the following well:

State #21-32B
1300’ FNL and 1880’ FWL (Surface)
NE NW Section 32, T9S - R19E

As required by the Utah bivision of Oil, Gas and Mining, we must notify all working interest owners
within a 460 foot radius of all points along the intended well bore. Attached for your review are copies of the
survey plat.

If you have no objection to the drilling of these wells, please Indicate by signing below. Please retum
this letter to Gasco Production Company as soon as possible.

Sincerely,
Mari A. Johnson
Gasco Production Company
I / (j@ 3-28-07
gse %.20.0% Date
8 inverness Drive East, Swji Tek (303} 483-0044 Email:  invest@gascosnergy.com

Englewcod, CO 80112-8628 Fex: (308) 483-0011 Webzite: www.gsscoanergy.com AMEX: GSX
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(6/23/2007) Diana Mason - Well Cleara”f

From: Ed Bonner

To: Mason, Diana

Date: 5/22/2007 5:05 PM

Subject: Well Clearance

CC: Davis, Jim; Garrison, LaVonne; Hill, Brad; Hunt, Gil

The following wells have been given cultural resources clearance by the Trust Lands Cultural Resources Group:

Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc
LCU 5-36F (API 43 047 38785)

Gasco Production Company
State 21-32B (API 43 047 39170)
State 22-32A (API 43 047 39171)
State 21-32A (API 43 047 39172)

Kerr McGee Oil & Gas Onshore LP
NBU 1021-29L (API 43 047 39009)
NBU 1021-290 (API 43 047 39010)
NBU 1021-29N (API 43 047 39011)
NBU 1021-29] (API 43 047 39012)
NBU 1021-29K (API 43 047 39013)
NBU 1021-291 (API 43 047 39014)
NBU 1021-29G (API 43 047 39015)
NBU 1021-29F (API 43 047 39016)
NBU 1021-29E (API 43 047 39017)
NBU 1021-29C (API 43 047 39018)
NBU 1021-29A (API 43 047 39019)
NBU 1021-29P (API 43 047 39110)

Royale Energy, Inc
Trail Canyon 1-1 (API 43 019 31531)
Trail Canyon 2-1 (API 43 019 31532)

XTO Energy, Inc
State of Utah 18-7-1-13 (API 43 015 30694)

If you have any questions regarding this matter please give me a call.

Page 1



State o, Utah A

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

Division of Oil Gas and Mining
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor JOHN R. BAZA

Division Director
GARY R. HERBERT

Lieutenant Governor

June 25, 2007

Gasco Production Company
8 Invernerss Dr East, Suite 100
Englewood, CO 80112

Re: State 21-32B Well, 1300' FNL, 1880' FWL, NE NW, Sec. 32. T. 9 South, R. 19 East,
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah

Administrative Code R649-3-1 ef seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative approval of
the requested exception location is hereby granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-39170.

Sincerely,
Gil Hunt
Associate Director
er
Enclosures
cc: Uintah County Assessor

SITLA

UTAH

DNR
/4(-/

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS & MINING



Operator: Gasco Production Company

Well Name & Number State 21-32B

API Number: 43-047-39170

Lease: - ML 45172

Location: _NE NW Sec._ 32 T._9 South R. _19 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
action during drilling of this well:
e 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing — contact Dan Jarvis
e 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment — contact Dan Jarvis
e 24 hours prior to spudding the well — contact Carol Daniels
e Within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling
program — contact Dustin Doucet

e Prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well — contact Dan
Jarvis

The operator is required to get approval from the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining before
performing any of the following actions during the drilling of this well:

e Plugging and abandonment or significant plug back of this well — contact Dustin
Doucet

e Any changes to the approved drilling plan — contact Dustin Doucet

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their telephone numbers
(please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

e Dan Jarvis at: (801) 538-5338 office (801) 942-0873 home
e Carol Daniels at: (801) 538-5284 office
e Dustin Doucet at: (801) 538-5281 office (801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.
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43-047-39170
June 25, 2007

Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns)
have not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
“Board”). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its
analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon
which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.



GASCO
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GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
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(DENTIAL

] 01S /e 19 S 32
Y3-092-39/40

STHIE. 31-22R AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22"
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 9/25/07 DAYS: 6
Current: Operations: RIG ON DOWN TIME: working on top drive
[Depth:  3246' ]Prog: 0 Ip Hrs: 0 |ave ropP 0.0 |rormation: UINTA
DMC: $0 [tmc: $4,600 TDC: $16,050 jcwc: $421,100
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 8.4 |#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |Bit#: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 26 ISPM: 100 ISIze: 12.25  |surf.Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ 9,000
[PVIYP: 1 I#Z PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |[Type: HPS51A Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $
Gel: W |sem: 100 JMEG: REED IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,800
WL: A GPM : 700 ISIN: AL5076 |Fioat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 850
Cake: T IPress: 1150 Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Isolids: E AV DC: 177 TD Out: 3246 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet: $
IMBT R AV DP: 124 |Depth in: 3140 fpackers: $ - CAMP: $
l; : 8.9 JetVel: 192 IFTG: 146 Tanks: $ - Logging: X
PH/MF: .30/4.60 |eco: 8.42 |Hrs: 2.5 |Separator: $ - e t $ -
Chior: 1700 ISPR #: | 58.0 |Heater: $ - |Bits: $
Ca : 40 ISPR #2: WOB: 40/44 IPumping ur:  $ - Mud Motors: $
IDapp ppb: 2 IBtm.Up: 25 [R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 70 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 2,000
START END TIME 59.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 56.0 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $
6:00 06:00 24.00 JCONTINUE REPAIR TOP DRIVE. SH OULD BE READY AROUND 08:00 A.M. Misc. / Labor: $400
Csg. Crew: $
Daily Total: $ 16,050
Cum. Wtr: $ 5,600
Cum. Fuel $ 24,200
Cum. Bits: $ 36,000
BHA
IBits: 1.00
les. 3.00
leoc 88.91
0 Depth Feet To Go X/O 2.25
0 Wasatch 5285' 2039’ 15-6"DC 468.02
0 Mesaverde 9115 5869’
0 Castlegate 11575 8329’
0 Desert 11805’ 8559'
0 Grassy 11915’ 8669’
0 Sunnyside 12030' 8784' TOTAL BHA = 563.18
0 Spring Canyor  12500' 9254’ Survey 11/2 2775
24.00 |TD 14250' 14250' BOlLERJ 0 Survey 2 3220
P/U K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS
S/0 K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ PEAK GAS
EIEL_ Used: 372 On Hand: 7384 CoMan JIMWEIR TRIP GAS
BIT # _ 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
| CONDITION 1 1 wt | GAUGE/HEEL 1RECFE n/a td
SEP 2 5 2007

NIV. OF OIL. GAS & MINING




GASCO

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CNFIDENTIAL

7095 R |9F S-39.

Energy Y3-042- 39, 2.0
AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22"
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 9/26/07 DAYS: 7
Current: Operations: Rig Down Conductor
Depth: 3246' |Prog: 0 |D Hrs: 0 |AVG ROP 0.0 IFormatIon: UINTA
DMC: $0 ltmc: $4,600 TDC: $154,133 |cwe: $591,283
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-l Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 8.4 I#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 26 ISPM: 100 ISize: Jsurf. Csg: $ 85,000 |Rig Move: $ -
lpvive: 1 |#2 pz-10 =3.48GPs |rype: fet. cso: $ - |payRate: $ 9583
Gel: W |sem: 100 JMFG: IProd Csg: 3 - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
wi: A GPM : 700 ISIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 550
[cake: T JPross: 1150 Jots: Well Head: $ - |water: $§ 7,500
ISoIIds: E AV DC: 177 D Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $
IMBT R AV DP: 124 JDepth In: JPackers: $ - |camp: $ 600
IPH : 8.9 JetVel: 192 IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: )
IPf/Mf: .30/4.60 {ecp: 8.42 IHrs: |Separator: $ - |cement: $ 36,000
Chlor: 1700 ISPR #: IFPH: IHeater: $ - |Bits: $
Ca : 40 ISPR #2: WOB: lPumping ur: $ - Mud Motors: $
hDapp ppb: 2 IBtm.Up: 25 JR-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 67.5 | Total Rot. Hrs: 56.0 IDain Total: $ 85,000 |Drilling Mud: $
6:00 14:00 8:00 [Downtime Top Drive,Trip in hole ,Circ ,spot pill, Trip out of hole - LD 8" DC Misc. / Labor: $0
14:00 14:30 :30 [Pre Tour Saftey Meeting Rig back on Daywork @14:00 pm on8/25/07 Csg. Crew: $ 11,500
14:30 15:30 1:00 |Rig up Casers jDaily Total: $ 154,133
15:30 | 20:00 | 4:30 |Run 76 jts of 8 5/8 casing foum. we: $ 13,100
20:00 21:30 1:30 |Circulate -change out elevator bales ICum. Fuel $ 24,200
21:30 2:00 4:30 R/ u Cement w Schlumberger : Cement with 560 sx lead,yield3.89,weight 11#,H20 26.5 ICum. Bits: $ 36,000
Tail370 sxs Class G +adds Den 15.8,H204.89,yield 1.15. Slowed pump down to BHA
2 bbls/min @ 40bbls on displacement till 20 bbls left stop pumps for approx 3min. Started ]Bits:
Joack on displacement @ 2 bbls/min took pressure @1400 psi.Plug didn’t bump like IMtr -.15 #6251
17.6bbls to finish displacement ,circulated 177.4 bbls to pit -Cement stayed at surface
Cecked float held ,rig down cementers hMoneI
2:00 6:00 4:00 Jwait on Cement and nipple down conductor
0 Depth Feet To Go IBS
0 Wasatch 5285 2039' 6.5 DC
0 Mesaverde 9115" 5869’ IIBS
0 Castlegate __ 11575' 8329' RECEIVED |i4es0c
0 Desert 11805 8559" ey
0 Grassy 11915° 8669" otr £ S_ZGU l
0 Sunnyside 12030' 8784' o JTOTAL BHA = 0.00
0 Spring Canyor 12500’ 9254’ DIV, OF OIL, UAS SN Survey 112 2778
24.00 |TD 14250° 14250 BOlLERI 0 Survey 2 3220
jpiv K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS
S/0 K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS
|ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ PEAK GAS
IFUEL Used: 1221 On !jgnd: 5445 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT # 4 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION




GASCO ENERGY

‘f“s\u

HOEN

TIAL

GASCO o
E—"'_’"‘— DAILY DRILLING REPORT / 7095 R [ 9F S3).
nergy AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59L(27 95" 1%9'48’3 2/ .70
STHrE /=328
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 9/27/07 DAYS: 8
Current: Operations: Tripping in hole
Depth: 3246' IProg: 0 ID Hrs: 0 IAVG ROP 0.0 IFormatlon: UINTA
DMC: $1,400 [tmc: $6,000 TDC: $94,200 |cwe: $685,483
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 8.8 |#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS [Bit#: 4 JConductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 26 ISPM: ISIza: 77/8 ISurf. Csg: $ - [Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 1 |#2 PZ-10 =3.48 GPS [Type: 506z Ilnt. Csg: $ - |pay Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: W SPM: jMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
WL: A GPM : S/N: 4089449 IFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: T hPress: Jots: 6x15 Well Head: $ 8,500 [water: $ -
ISolids: E AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ 26,000
IMBT R AV DP: JDepth In: 3246 JPackers: $ - |camp: $ 600
IPH : 8.8  LJetvel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - |eYRo $ 15,000
lele: .30/4.60 |ecp: IHrs: Separator: $ - |welding $ 1,700
Chlor: 2500 ISPR #: IFPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ica: 20 ISPR #2: woB: IPumpinngT: $ " Mud Motors: $ 10,000
IDapp ppb: 2 IBtm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover:  § - |BOP Test $ 2,400
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: [Mlsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 67.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 56.0 IDaIIy Total: $ 8,500 |Drilling Mud: $ 1,400
6:00 12:00 6:00 [install Well head and test head Misc. / Labor: $2,200
12:00 17:00 5:.00 INipple up BOP Csg. Crow: $ -
17:00 21:00 4:00 |]Test BOP -lower and upper pipe rams,blind rams,choke manifold, HCR,TIW Daily Total: $ 94,200
Gray valve,and all service equipment Cum. Wr: $ 13,100
21:00 | 23:30° | 2:30 |Gyro well with Multishot Cum. Fuel $ 50,200
23:30 1:30 2:00 [install rotating head ,and flowline Cum. Bits: $ 36,000
1:30 | 4:00 | 2:30 |pwBHATripin hole BHA
4:00 5:30 1:30 JLaydown 48 jts IBits: 1.00
530 | 6:00 | :30 [Tripin Hole Imer-.1s  [#6251 35.51
[Monel 31.05
IBS 5.70
6.5 DC 30.91
0 Depth Feet To Go 1BS 5.95
0 Wasatch 5030° 1784’ RECEIVED li-6s50c 437.09
0 Mesaverde 8805 5559' ~—— . =
0 Castlegate 11240’ 7994 oEF LT ZUU?
0 Desert 11495 8249 O e A bbbt
0 Grassy 11620° 374" DIV OF OI GAS & MIRING
0 Sunnyside 11705 8459’ TOTAL BHA = 547.21
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ 8944’ Survey
24.00 |tp 14250° 11004' BOILER] 0 Survey
 [4Y) K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS
S/O K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ PEAK GAS
& Used: 1221 On Hand: 5445 Co.Man JIMWEIR TRIP GAS
BIT # 4 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP

[ CONDITION




G 3ASCO GASCO ENERGY - CONFIDENTINL
‘ h‘nergy DAILY DRILLING REPORT 7’07@ </ 7£ S 3.
AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22"
STHIE 21-334 L3049 3G /20
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 9/28/07 DAYS: 9
Current: Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 4197 IProg: 951 lD Hrs: 12 1/2 IAVG ROP 76.0 IFormatlon: UINTA
DMC: $1,000 [TmC: $7,000 TDC: $29,450 [cwc: $714,933
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-t Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 8.5 I#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS hBIt #: 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
vis: 26 IgM: 75 lSIze: 77/8 |Surt. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
pvive: 1 I#Z PZ-10 =3.48 GPS [rype: 506z Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gol: 111 |sem: 75 |wre: HTC froacss:  § - [Rental Tools: $ 2,400
WL: n/c GPM : 526 SIN: 4089449 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 1280 Jots: 6x15 Woell Head: $ - Water: $ -
ISolids: 0 AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
|MBT AV DP: Dopth In: 3246 Packers: $ - |camp: $ -
Im : 9.1 JetVel: IFTG: 951 Tanks: $ - |eYRo 3 -
IPfIMf: .60/5.00 Jecp: |Hrs: 12.5 Separator: $ - Directional $ 450
Chior: 2500 ISPR #1: FPH: 76.0 Heator: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 20 ISPR #2: WOB: 18/20 IPumping ur: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 1,600
Dapp ppb: 2 IBtm.Up: 10 R-RPM: 60/70 Prime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 80/86 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 67.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 68.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,000
6:00 9:00 3:00 |Pick up drill pipe - Trip in Hole Misc. / Labor: $0
9:00 15:30 6:30 % Cement f/ 2889 - 3242 Csg. Crew: $ -
15:30 16:00 :30 [integrety test @ 11.5ppg wt - ok Daily Total: $ 29,450
16:00 17:30 1:30 |Drig f/ 3246 - 3404 (158 @105.3fph) Cum. Wir: $ 13,100
17:30 18:00 :30  |Survey Cum. Fuel $ 50,200
18:00 19:00 1:00 [Drlg f/ 3404 - 3498 (94° @ 94fph) Cum. Bits: $ 36,000
19:00 | 19:30 :30__|Rig Service -Grease Top Drive & lower control valve BHA
19:30 | 2:00 | 6:30 |Drigf/ 3498 - 3975 (477 @73.4fph) Isits: 1.00
2:00 2:30 :30 |Survey Mtr - .15 #6251 35.51
2:30 | 6:00 3:30_|Drig f/ 3975 - 4197 (222 @63.4fph) [Monel 31.05
1BS 5.70
6.5 DC 30.91
0 Depth Feet To Go IBS 5.95
0 Wasatch 5030° 833" 14 -6.5 DC 437.09
0 Mesaverde 8805’ 4608' RECEIVED
0 Castlegate 11240° 7043" .
0 Desertg 11495’ 7208" OEF £ 8_2007
0 Grassy 11620" 7423 o
0 Sunnyside 11705" 7508" DIV OF O GRS & MNING 1AL Bra = 54721
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ 7993’ Survey 1.5 3306'
24.00 |t 14250° 10053’ BOlLERI 0 Survey 1.8 3878
P/U 140 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 350
S/0 133 K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS 2200
ROT. 135 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 350
LU_EL Used: 1580 On Hand: — 12444 Co.Man RICK FELKER TRIP_GAS N/S
BIT # 4 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

[ CONDITION




srszorumn UourIDENTIAL

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-45172
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NA
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to N A

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals

1. TYPE OF WELL oL weLL [ GASWELL [7]  OTHER 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
State 21-32B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 9. AP| NUMBER.
Gasco Production Company 4304739170

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT.

8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 Englewood Co 80112 (303) 483-0044 Pariette Bench

4. LOCATION OF WELL

rootaces aTsurrace: 1300' FNL & 1880' FWL county: Uintah
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN. NENW 32 gS 19E STATE:
UTAH
1 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[] acioize [/] oeePen [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

/1 NoTiCE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [] atercasing [] rracTure TrReAT [[] sipeTRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start [] casin REPAR [] wewconstrRucTION [C] remporariLY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [[J oeeraTor cHangE [] tusincrepar
[[] cHance Tueing [T] PLuc anp ABANDON [[] ventorFiare

[ sueseQuenT REPORT [] chHance wewt Name ] rpucsack [[] wareroisposac

{Submit Original Form Only)
[] cHance weLL sTaTUS [:| PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] water sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion

[[] comminGLe PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE [ orer
[J converrwew Tvpe [J RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well is currently permitted to 11830 and is currently drilling at 3246

Gasco Production Co would like to attempt to complete this well within the Mancos at 14,250
The maximum anticipated mud weight will be 11.2# gallon

The only change to the casing design will be the additional footage of 4-1/2" 15.1#/ft P-110
LT&C casing.

The cement design has been revised to accommodate the additional well depth. Additionaily
the cement system to be used has been revised as follows:

523 sacks of 35:65 Poz "G" 11.5 PPG, 3.05 yield

1635 sacks 50:50 Poz "G", 14.1 PPG, Yield =1.28 cu.ft/sk

This cement design should result in a cement top at 2500'. If hole conditions indicate, the number
of sacks of cement will be increased to achieve a calculated cement top of 2500". Final top of
cement will be verified by CBL.

_Beverly Walker me Engineering Technician

NAME (PLEASE PRIN{T/)

gGNATuRE/(i/jZ[/u//‘,L[(/ v//[?///é oate 912712007

This space for State use on APPR J ‘ b
‘ ” OF UTAH DIVISION OF

OiL, GAS, £ D MINING RECEIVED

paTENe/S[0 T — SEP 2 & 2007
{5/2000) BY: Structions on Reverse Side)

DIV. OF UiL, Gas & MINING




Well name:

Operator: Gasco Production Company

String type:  Production Project ID:
43-047-39170

Location: Uintah County

2007-05 Gasco State 21-32Brev.

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 11.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 274 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 2,499 ft

Burst @9 DE

Max anticipated surface 5"/\ 9 &:L Sto
pressur%: 5,378 psi'/2 200 e P rEs” retello €. € ox g
Internal gradient: 0.220 psi/ft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 8,513 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)
Tension is based on buoyed weight.
Neutral point: 11,765 ft
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
") (in) (Tbs/ft) (ft) () (in) (ft’)

1 14250 4.5 15.10 P-110 LT&C 14250 14250 3.701 1137.7
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) {psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) {Kips) Factor

1 8513 14350 1.686 8513 14420 1.69 178 406 229J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801-538-5357 Date: October 8,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 14250 ft, a mud weight of 11.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for coliapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



2007-05 Gasco State 21-32Brev.

Casing Schematic
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GASCO

Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

3-049~

CONFIDENT
Topa AL

%
GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.2 "70

37797@ 13202 AFE # 70201
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 9/29/07 DAYS: 10
Current: Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 5659’ [Prog: 1462 |pHrs: 181/2 |ave rop 79.0  [Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $15,000 ITMC: $22,000 TDC: $53,250 JCWC: $768,183
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 8.5 I#‘l PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |Bit#: 4 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $
viS: 26 ISPM: 80 Size: 77/8 Jsurf. Csq: $ - Rig Move: $ -
Ipvivp: 1 ';2 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |[rype: 506z Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
IGoI: 111 ISPM: 80 IMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
WL n/c GPM : 562 ISIN: 4089449 IFIoal Equp: $ 5,500 |Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPross: 1580 Jots: 6x15 Well Head: $ - Wator: $ -
Isolids: 0 AV DC: 530 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fusl: $ -
IMBT AV DP: 287 JDepth In: 3246 [Packers: $ - |lcamp: $ -
IPH : 8.4 JetVel: 153 lFTG: 2413 Tanks: $ - |survey, Surface damag $§ 3,500
IPfIMf: .10/6.60 Jecp: 8.72 IHrs: 31 {Separator: $ - Directional $ 450
Chlor: 2500 [SPR # IFPH: 77.8 lHeater: $ - Bits: $ -
lca : 20 ISPR #2 woB: 20/23 IPumping ur: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2400
IDapp ppb: 6 IBtm.Up: 12.8 JR-RPM: 60/70 IPrIme Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 80/86 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 70 Total Rot. Hrs: 87.0 |Daily Total: $ 5,500 |Drilling Mud: $ 15,000
6:00 6:30 :30 |[Drlg f/ 4197 - 4261 (64 @128'fph) Misc. / Labor: $0
6:30 9:00 2:30 ]|Downtime - lower control valve Csg. Crow: $ -
9:00 10:00 1:00 |Rig Service and function test Pipe rams Daily Total: $ 53,250
10:00 11:30 1:30 |Drlg f/ 4261 - 4450 (189°@126fph) Cum. Wir: $ 13,100
11:30 12:00 :30  JSurvey Cum. Fuel $ 50,200
12:00 17:30 5:30 |Drigf/ 4450 - 4928 (478 @86.9fph) Cum. Bits: $ 36,000
17:30 18:00 :30  |Survey BHA
18:00 2:30 8:30 |Drlg /4929 - 5400 471" @55.4fph) Isits: 1.00
230 | 300 | :30 [Survey fver- .15 us251 35.51
3:00 | 6:00 3:00 |prig /5500 - 5659 (159 @53.3 fph) Imoner 31.05
Well started flowing @6 gal min @4785 IBS 5.70
Approx 4450 - 4630 fractured with high p-rates - well took approx : 100bbls of fluid l6.5 DC 30.91
0 Depth Feet To Go IBS 5.95
0 Wasatch 5030° -629° 14 -6.5 DC 437.09
0 Mesaverde 8805 3146' R
0 Castlegate 11240' 5581" H tbt‘l Vl:ﬁ
0 Desert 11495' 5836’ 0CT 012007 |TOTALBHA= 547.21
0 Grassy 11620° 5061° e Survey 14| 4357
0 Sunnyside 11705 6046’ o AR AL CAS R AN gSurvey 3.2 4829'
0 Spring Canyor  12190" 6531' T Survey 25| 5402
24.00 |Tp 14250° 8591° BOlLERI 0 Survey
P/U 166 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 250
S/0 157 K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS 2800
ROT. 160 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 5100
FUEL Used: 1000 On Hand: 11444 Co.Man RICK FELKER TRIP GAS n/a
BIT # 4 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP

| CONDITION




GASCO GASCO ENERGY LCAFIDENT AL

Fner DAILY DRILLING REPORT 075 "’ / TE 53 ,
I= 077 3“?‘1?0 39170
67"2@§X32/8 AFE # 70201 GPS 39592795 109482 2
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 9/30/07 DAYS: 1
Current: Operations: DRILLING
Ipepth:  6922' |Prog: 1263 | Hrs: 23 |ave roP 54.9  [Formation: WASATCH
lomc: $2,300 lTmc: $24,300 TDC: $32,425 |cwe: $768,183
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMw: 8.7 |#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS  |Bit #: 4 |Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
vis: 26 ISPM: 80 |size: 77/8 [Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 1 |#2 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS [Type: 506z Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gol: 1/1/1 ISPM: 80 jmFa: HTC IProd Csy: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2400
wL: n/c IGPM : 562 ISIN: 4089449 [Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 400
Cake: IPress: 1580 Jots: 6x15 Woll Hoad: $ - |water: $ -
Isolids: 2.6 Javoc: 530 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
|MBT AV DP: 287 Ipepth In: 3246 |Packers: $ - ICAMP: $ -
IPH : 8.4 JotVel: 153 IFTG: 3676 Tanks: $ - |survey, Surface damag $ -
IPfIMf: .20/4.20 Jecp: 8.9 |Hrs: 54 ISeparator: $ - |oirectional $ 450
Chlor: 2500 lSPR #1: FPH: 68.0 lHeater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 20 ISPR #2: WOB: 23/25 IPumpIng ut: $ = |Mud Motors: $ 2875
IDapp ppb: 6 IBtm.Up: 18.4 JR-RPM: 60/65 IPrlme Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 80/86 IMIsc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 70 I Total Rot. Hrs: 110.0 IDaHy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,300
06:00 | 11:00 5.00 |Drlgf/ 5659 - 5977 (318" @63.6fph) Misc. / Labor: $0
11:00 | 11:30 | 0:30 |Survey fcsg. crow: $ -
11:30 19:00 7:30 |Drigf/5977 - 6454 (477@63.6fph) Daily Total: $ 32425
19:00 19:30 0:30 |Survey JCum. Wir: $ 13,100
19:30 | 06:00 | 10:30 |Drlgf/6454 - 6922 (468" @44.6fph) ICum. Fuel $ 50,200
06:00 [cum. Bits: $ 36,000
0 BHA
0 [Bits: 1.00
0 Imr- .15 [#6251 35.51
0 Jmoner 31.05
0 s 5.70
0 6.5 oc 30.91
Depth Feet To Go IIBS 5.95
0 Wasatch 5030' -1892' [P 14 -6.5 DC 437.09
0 Mesaverde 8805 1883’ HeLeivey
0 Castlegate 11240’ 4318' 567512007
0 Desert 11495’ 4573' TOTAL BHA = 547.21
0 Grassy 11620 4698’ TN CAS & ] uiNING  Jsurvey 2.5 5883'
0 Sunnyside 11705' 4783 TR Survey 20| 6357
0 Spring Canyor 12190" 5268" Survey
24.00 |o 14250’ 7328 BOILER| 0 Survey
P/U 186 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 100
S/0 171 K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS 500
ROT. 180 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 4900
E_UE_L Used: 1250 On Hand: 10194 Co.Man RICK FELKER TRIl?_GAs n/a
BIT # 4 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION
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Energy Y3-047- 39170
THE. 21-333 AFE # 70201 GPS- 39 % 27.95" 109'48'25.22
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/1/07 DAYS: 12
Current: Operations: DRILLING
Depth: __ 7471'_|Prog: 549  |pHrs: 13 lavG RoP 422 |rormation: WASATCH
DMC: $1,000 [tmc: $25,300 TDC: $39,825 Jcwec: $808,008
Contractor: Nabors 99 M- Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
fpaw: 87 |# Pz10=348GPS |sits: 4 5  lconductor: 8 - |Loccost: $
vis: 26 ISPM: 80 ISIze: 77/8 77/8 ISurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
[PVIYP: 1 I#2 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS [Type: 506z 506zx Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gol: 1/1/1 ISPM: 80 IMFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2400
W nc__ |oem: 562 |s: 4089449 | 7108285 |riostEqup:  $ - |rrucking: $ 400
Cake: Press: 1580 Jots: 6x15 6x16 Woll Head: $ - |water: $ -
Isolids: 2.6 AV DC: 530 TD Out: 7440 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
IMBT AV DP: 287 Jpepth In: 3246 7440  |Packers: 3 - |camp: $ 950
[PH : 8.4 JotVel: 163 IFTG: 4194 31 Tanks: $ - Survey, Surface damag_$ -
IPfIMf: .20/4.20 Jeco: 8.9 IHrs: 66 1 ISeparator: $ - Directional 3 450
IChlor: 2500 ISPR #1: IFPH: 63.5 31.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000
E : 20 ISPR #2: WOB: 23/25 14/18 lPumping ur:  $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,625
IDapp ppb: 6 IBtm.Up: 18.4 JR-RPM: 60/65 60/65 IPrime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 80/86 80/86 lMlsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 70 I Total Rot. Hrs: 123.0 IDain Total: $ - |Driliing Mud: $ 1,000
06:00 | 06:30 0:30 |Survey Misc. / Labor: $0
06:30 08:30 2:00 |Drlgf/ 6922 - 7027 (105" @52.5fph) Csg. Crew: $ -
08:30 | 09:00 0:30 {Rig Service |Daily Totat: $ 39,825
09:00 | 19:00 [ 10:00 |Drlgfl 7027 - 7440 (413 @41.3fph) foum. whr. $ 13,100
19:00 19:30 0:30 |Drop Survey, spot pill Cum. Fuel $ 50,200
19:30 | 22:30 3:00 |Trip out of hole Cum. Bits: $ 45,000
22:30 00:00 1:30 _]Change out MTR,BIT ,check wear bushing BHA
00:00 [ 00:30 0:30 |Function test pipes and blinds Isits: 1.00
00:30 | 04:30 4:00 |Trip in Hole -install rotating head /fill pipe@ shoe and 10 stds off btmIMtr- A5 [#6116 35.51
04:30 | 500 [ 0:30 |wash to btm , no fill- break in bit [Monei 31.05
5:00 6:00 1:00 ]Drig / 7440 - 7471 (31 @31fph) IBS 5.70
6:00 J6.5 BC 30.91
Depth Feet To Go IBS 5.95
0 Wasatch 5030 -2441' 14 6.5 DC 437.09
0 Mesaverde 8805' 1334’ R FCE!VED
0 Castlegate 11240" 3769°
0 [Desert 11495’ 4024 Jul 07 2007 TOTAL BHA = 547.21
0 Grassy 11620° 4149° Survey 2.5 5883'
0 Sunnyside 11705’ 4234’ DO GAS ERMINING  |survey 2.0] 6357
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ 4719’ Survey 2.2 6833’
24,00 |10 14250° 6779' BOlLERI 0 Survey 21 7404'
P/U 186 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 100
S/O 171 K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS 500
iROT. 180 Ki# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 5100
|FUEL Used: 1000 On Hand: 9194 Co.Man RICK FELKER TRIP GAS 5100
BIT # 4 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
| CONDITION 0 1 ct s X ! no pr




GASCO

GASCO ENERGY

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT S
;57‘%2,1‘ )-22343 AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'?9'3277.9?// %3'2324.'275
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/2/07 DAYS: 13
Current: Operations: DRILLING
[Depth:  8500' |Prog: 1029 D Hrs: 23 |ave roP 44.7  [Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $3,800 ITMC: $29,100 TDC: $59,750 |JCWC: $900,183
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-1 Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: 8.8 I#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS [Bit#: 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
vis: 27 |sem: 75 |size: 77/8 Jsurt. csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
IPvive: 1 I#Z PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |[Type: 506zx Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 111 ISPM: 75 JMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 2,400
WL: n/c GPM : 530 ISIN: 7108285 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
JCake: Press: 1700 | Jots: 6x16 (Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
ISoIIds: 0 AV DC: 467 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - {Fuel $ 26,200
IMBT AV DP: 252 |Depth in: 7440 IPackers: $ - |camp: $ -
I;H : 8.4 JotVel: 135 IFTG: 1060 Tanks: $ - Survey, Surface damag$ -
[Pfle: .10/5.00 feco: 8.9 IHrs: 24 Iseparator: $ - Directional $ 450
Chior: 2500 ISPR #: [epn: 31.0 IHeater: $ - Isits: $ -
lca : 20 ISPR #2: WOB: 25/26 IPumping ur: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,900
IDapp ppb: 6 Etm.Up: 28 |R-RPM: 60/65 IPrime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 80/86 IMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 70 I Total Rot. Hrs: 146.0 IDain Total: $ - {Drilling Mud: $ 3,800
06:00 | 10:30 4:30 |Drlg f/ 7471 - 7789 (318" @70.6fph) Misc. / Labor: $0
10:30 | 11:00 | 0:30 |Rig Service fcss. crew: $ -
11:00 16:00 5:00 |Drlg f/ 7789 - 8075 (286" @57.2fph) Daily Total: $ 59,750
16:00 16:30 0:30 |Survey Cum. Wtr: $ 13,100
16:30 | 06:00 | 13:30 |Drilling /8075 - 8500 (425 @31.5fph) Cum. Fuel $ 76,400
06:00 Cum. Bits: $ 45,000
0 BHA
0 IBits: 1.00
0 Iwr-15 #6116 35.51
0 Jmoner 31.05
0 fies 5.70
0 fes oc 30.91
Depth Feet To Go IBS 5.95
0 Wasatch 5030° -3470' 14 -6.5 DC 437.09
0 Mesaverde 8805 305'
0 Castlegate 11240' 2740
0 Desert 11495’ 2995" TOTAL BHA = 547.21
0 Grassy 11620' 3120’ Survey 1.9 8036'
0 Sunnyside 11705’ 3205’ Survey
0 Spring Canyor 12190° 3690° Survey
24.00 [ro 14250° 5750° BOILER] 0 Survey
PIU 211 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 100
S/0 203 K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS 2200
ROT. 205 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 5000
[FUEL _ Used: 1222 On Hand: 14996 Co.Man RICK FELKER TRIP GAS n/a
BIT # 5 ICS 0oCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP

[ CONDITION
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%w Z)~23/3 AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/3/07 DAYS: 14
Current: Operations: DRILLING
Depth: __ 8857'_|Prog: 357  |pHrs: 111/2 |ave RoP 31.0  [Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $8,000 [Tmc: $37,100 TDC: $52,600 |cwe: $952,783
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
mw: 9.6 |#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS _|Bit#: 5 6 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $
vIS: 42 ISPM: 80 ISize: 77/8 77/8 |surt. csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
EPVIY P: 12/20 I#2 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |Jrype: 5062x 5062x Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $§ 23,000
Gel: 12/29/36 |spm: 80 IMFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
WL: 16 GPM : 558 ISIN: 7108285 7107060 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: Press: 2230 Jots: 6x16 6x16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 5500
Isolids: 7 AV DC: 526 TD Out: 8840 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fue: $ -
IMBT 14.5 Javoe: 285 |Depth In: 7440 8840 |Packers: $ - |camp: 3 -
I;l : 8.4 JotVel: 152 IFTG: 1400 17 Tanks: $ - Survey, Surface damag $ -
IPfle: .10/4.00 Jecp: 10.2 lHrs: 34 1.5 |separator: $ - Directional $ 450
Chior: 2500 ISPR #:  30@250 [eph: 41.1 11.3 |Heater: $ - |sits: $ 9,000
Ca : 20 ISPR #2:  40@400 WOoB: 25/26 20/23 |Pumpin9 ur: $ - |{Mud Motors: $ 1,250
Dapp ppb: 55 IBtm.Up: 28 |R-RPM: 60/65 60/65 lPrime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 80/86 IMIsc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 70 I Total Rot. Hrs: 157.5 lDaIIy Total: $ = |orilting Mug: $ 8,000
06:00 10:00 4:00 |Drlg f/ 8500 - 8647 {147 @36.7 fph) Misc. / Labor: $2,000
10:00 10:30 0:30 |Survey Csg. Crew: $ -
10:30 | 13:00 2:30 |Drlg f/ 8647 - 8741 (94’ @37.6 fph) |Daily Total: $ 52,600
13:00 13:30 0:30 [Rig Service Cum. Wir: $ 18,600
13:30 | 17:00 3:30 |Drlg f/ 8741 - 8840 (99°@28.2fph) Cum. Fuel $ 76,400
17:00 18:00 1:00 [Work Stuck Pipe Cum. Bits: $ 54,000
18:00 | 19:00 | 1:00 |Spot dry job BHA
19:00 | 23:00 4:00 |[Trip for Bit |Bits: 1.00
23:00 | 00:00 1:00 ]LD Stabilizers,MTR,Bit/ make up bit and bit sub IBIt sub 3.18
00:00 | 00:30 | 0:30 [Work BOP - Pipe and Blind Rams [Monel 31.05
00:30 | 04:00 3:30 |Trip in Hole - break circ @ shoe,install RH -10 stds off btm 15-DC 61/2 463.76
04:00 | 04:30 :30 |Wash to bottom - Break in Bit
04:30 | 06:00 1:30 |Drlg f/ 8840 - 8857
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030 -3827" R_ECEI¥ED
0 Mesaverde 8805’ -52' .
0 Castlegate 11240° 2383’ 0CT 03 2007
0 Desert 11495’ 2638’ TOTAL BHA = 498.99
0 Grassy 11620° 2763’ DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING |survey 17| 8550
0 Sunnyside 11705 2848 Survey
0 Spring Canyor 12190 3333 Survey
24.00 | 14250' 5393' BOILER| 0 Survey
P/U 211 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 100
S/I0 203 K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS 2200
ROT. 205 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 5000
FUEL Used: 1573 On Hand: 13423 Co.Man RICK FELKER TRIP GAS n/a
BIT # 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
| CONDITION 0 1 ct s X | wi pr mtr/stab
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT S—5=2
Energy AFE # 70201 Zﬁﬁsif{;s?% 45 o
Kl 354 ' '
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/4/07 DAYS: 15
Current: Operations: DRILLING
|pepth:  9873' |Prog: 1016 |p Hrs: 23 lave rop 44.2  [Formation: Mesaverde
lome: $1,200 [tmc: $38,300 TDC: $38,050 |cwe: $990,833
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-i Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jaw: 97 | pz10=348GPs [sits: 6 Conductor:  $ Loc,Cost: $
VIS: 40  |spm: 70 |size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
lpvrve: 12/18 |#2 Pz-10 =3.48GPS |rype: 5062x Jint. csg: $ Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gol: 12/29/36 |spm: 70 |mrc: HTC IProd Cso: $ Rental Tools: $ 2400
Wi 13.8 _ lorm: 500 fs: 7107060 [FrostEqup: _ $ Trucking: $ 2,000
Cake: IPress: 1515 Jots: 6x16 Woll Head: $ Water: $ -
Solids: 7 AV DC: 473 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ |Fuet: $ -
|mBT 14.5 Javop: 256 JDepth in: 8840 JPackers: $ CAMP: $ -
IPH : 8.4 JetVel: 137 IFTG: 1033 Tanks: $ Survey, Surface damay $ -
P/Mf: .10/3.60 Jecp: 10.2 IHrs: 24.5 ]Separator: $ Directional $ 450
Chlor: 2500 lser #1:  30@250 FPH: 421 |Heater: $ Bits: $ 8,000
Ca : 20 SPR#2: 40@400 WoB: 23/25 IPumping LT: $ Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 5 |Btm.up: 33 iR-RPM: 70/80 Prime Mover: $ BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: IMIsc: $ Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 70 | Total Rot. Hrs: 180.5 IDain Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ 1,200
06:00 11:30 5:30 |Drigf/8857 - 9174 (317" @57.6fph) Misc. / Labor: $0
11:30 12:00 0:30 |Survey Csg. Crew: $ -
12:00 | 23:30 | 11:30 |Drlg f/ 9174 -9651 (477 @41.4fph) Daily Total: $ 38,050
23:30 | 00:00 0:30 |Survey Cum. Wr: $ 18,600
00:00 06:00 6:00 |Drigf/ 9651 - 9873 (222° @37.0fph) Cum. Fuel $ 76,400
06:00 Cum. Bits: $ 62,000
0 BHA
0 RECEIVED IBits: 1.00
0 Igit sub 3.18
0 OCT 0% 2007 [onel 31.05
0 15-DC 61/2 463.76
0 DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING
0
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030 -4843'
0 Mesaverde 8805’ -1068"'
0 Castlegate 11240' 1367
0 Desert 11495’ 1622' TOTAL BHA = 498.99
0 Grassy 11620' 1747 Survey 1.9 9075'
0 Sunnyside 11705’ 1832 Survey 1.9 9557
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ 2317" Survey
24.00 |to 14250’ 4377 BOILER| 0 Survey
P/U 222 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 400
S/I0 209 K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS 1200
iROT. 215 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 6200
IFUEL Used: 1400 On Hand: 12023 Co.Man RICK FELKER TRIP GAS n/a
BIT # 6 ICS OoCsS DC LOC B/IS G oDC RP

| CONDITION
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GPS- 39'59'27 j / 109'48'25.22"

57ﬂ]_/2: 53/’302/8 AFE # 70201
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/5/07 DAYS: 16
Current: Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 10319’ |Prog: 446  |p Hrs: 12 |ave roP 37.2  |Formation: Mesaverde
IDMC: $4,000 |TMC: $42,300 TDC: $31,850 JCwWC: $1,022,683
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
faw: 101 |#1 Pz-10=3.48GPS |sits: 6 7 Conductor:  $ - [Locicost: $
vIS: 40 SPM: 70 ISize: 77/8 77/8 iSurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
pvivp: 12/18 |#2 PZ-10 =3.48 GPS Jrype: 5062x 5062x Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 12/28/36 |sPm: 70 IMFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
wL: 14 GPM : 500 |sm: 7107060 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: |Press: 1515 Jots: 6x16 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
|sotids: 10 AV DC: 467 TD Out: 10260 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuek $ -
IMBT 14.5 |avor: 252 [oepth In: 8840 10260  [Packers: $ - |cAMP: $ 600
lPH : 8.0 JotVel: 135 IFTG: 1420 59 Tanks: $ - Survey, Surface damay $ -
IPfIMf: .00/4.00 leco: 10.5 IHrs: 34.5 2 |Separator: $ - Directional $ 450
Chior: 2500 lSPR #1:  30@300 IFPH: 411 29.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 20  |spr#2: 40@450 woB: 25/27 18/20 IPumping vt $ - |mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5 |Btm.up: 37.4 |R-RPM: 70/80 70/75 Prime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: |Misc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 70 I Total Rot. Hrs: 192.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 4,000
06:00 | 11:30 5:30 ]Drlg /9873 - 10126 (253 @46.0fph) Misc. / Labor: $400
11:30 12:00 0:30 {Survey Csg. Crew: $ -
12:00 16:30 4:30 |Drig f/ 10126 - 10260 (134’ @29.7fph) Daily Total: $ 31,850
16:30 | 17:00 | 0:30 |Pump dry job Cum. Wir: $ 18,600
17:00 21:30 4:30 |Trip for bit - pull rotating head 10 stds off btm Cum. Fue! $ 76,400
21:30 | 22:00 0:30 |Check wear bushing ,change bit Cum. Bits: $ 62,000
22:00 00:00 2:00 [Trip in hole BHA
00:00 01:00 1:00 |Cut and Slip drilling line IBits: 1.00
01:00 4.00 3:00 [Trip in hole - install rotating head 10stds off btm IBit sub 3.18
4:00 6:00 2:00 |Break in bit, Drig /10260 - 10319 (59’ @29.5 fph) [Monel 31.05
6:00 15-DC 61/2 463.76
0
0 Degasser 24/7
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030' -5289'
0 Mesaverde 8805 -1514°' R EC E ! '[E
0 Castlegate 11240 921’
0 Desert 11495' 1176’ OCT g 5 2007 TOTAL BHA = 498.99
0 Grassy 11620° 1301° Survey 1.9 9075
0 Sunnyside 11705' 1386' DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING [survey 19| 9557
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ 1871 Survey 2.3 10036
24.00 |0 14250' 3931° BOILER] 0 Survey
P/U 250 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 3000
SIO 215 K# FLARE: Gas Buster CONN GAS 3000
ROT. 226 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 6200
FUEL Used: 1509 On Hand: 10514 Co.Man RICK FELKER TRIP GAS 3200
BIT # 6 ICS 0CS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 0 2 ct s X I wt pr
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7472 9 ) - Fas AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'50'27.95" 109'48'25.22"
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/6/07 DAYS: 17
Current: Operations: Spotting Pill for Trip
[Depth: _ 11131' |Prog: 812 |pHrs: 22 |avG rRoP 36.9 |Formation: Mesaverde
DMC: $6,500 ITMC: $48,800 TDC: $35,350 |cwc: $1,058,033
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.5 I#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS [Bit#: 7 conductor: $ - |Loc,cost: $
vIS: 50 ISPM: 75 |sice: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |RigMove: $ -
{pvivp: 15/28 I#2 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |rype: 5062x fint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 15/35/41 lSPM: 75 |vFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
wL: 17 GPM : 500 Ism: 7112908 |Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: Press: 1920 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Isolids: 13 AV DC: 460 TD Out: 11131 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
IMBT 14.5 Javor: 252 |pepth In: 10260 JPackers: $ - |came: $ -
IPH : 8.3 JetvVel: 135 IFTG: 871 Tanks: $ - Survey, Surface dama; $ -
PH/Mf: .00/6.00 jecp: 11.1 |Hrs: 24 Jseparator: $ - Directional $ 450
Chlor: 2500 ISPR #:  30@300 IFPH: 36.2 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 20 ISPR #2:  40@450 woB: 18/20 IPumping ur:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 7 IBtm.Up: 40 |rR-RPM: 70/75 Prime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: |Misc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 70 | Total Rot. Hrs: 2145 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Dritling Mud: $ 6,500
06:00 15:30 9:30 |Drlg f/ 10319 - 10701 (382°@40.2fph) Misc. / Labor: $2,000
15:30 16:00 0:30 [Survey Csg. Crew: $ -
16:00 | 18:30 2:30 |Drig f/ 10701 - 10796 (95 @38 fph) Daily Total: $ 35,350
18:30 19:00 0:30 |Rig Service Cum. Wir: $ 18,600
19:00 | 05:00 | 10:00 |Drig f/ 10796 - 11131 (335’ @33.5fph Cum. Fuel $ 76,400
05:00 6:00 1:00 |Circ ,Build pill and spot . Cum. Bits: $ 62,000
6:00 BHA
0 — |Bits: 1.00
0 RECEIVED [git sub 3.18
0 Monel 31.05
0 0€F+02007 15-DC 612|  463.76
0 DW-OF OGS &
0 Degasser 24/7 VIL, GRS & MINING
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030 -6101"
0 Mesaverde 8805' -2326'
0 Castlegate 11240’ 109'
0 Desert 11495’ 364’ TOTAL BHA = 498.99
0 Grassy 11620' 489’ Survey 2.5 10609
0 Sunnyside 11705’ 574' Survey
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ 1059' Survey
24.00 |to 14250° 3119 BOILER] 0 Survey
PIU 263 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 7300
S/0 223 K# FLARE: 3’ flare while on vent Gas Buster CONN GAS 7300
ROT. 246 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 7300
EJ_EL_ Used: 1500 On Hand: 9014 Co.Man RICK FELKER TRIP GAS n/a
BIT # 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G 0obC RP

| CONDITION
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57 Are 2203 AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22
Woell: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/7/07 DAYS: 18
Current: Operations: Drilling
Depth: _ 11510' |Prog: 379  |pwrs: 141/2  |ave roP 26.1  |Formation: Castlegate/Grassy
DMC: $3,000 [Tme: $51,800 TDC: $77,000 |cwe: $1,135,033
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fiuids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW 105 |#1 pz10=3486Ps |eite: 7 8 Conductor:  $ - |Loscost: $
VIS: 38 ISPM: 0 |5ize: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
|pvive: 12/24 |#2 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS [Type: 5062x 5062+ Ilnt. Csg: $ - |payRate: $ 23,000
Gel: 14/28/35 |spm: 114 MFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
WL: 17 GPM : 400 Ism: 7112908 7115675 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 550
Cake: IPross: 1400 Jots: 6X16 4x16,2x14 |well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 13 |avoc: 460 TD Out: 11131 TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuek $ 27,100
JuBT 14.5 JavDp: 249 iDepth In: 10260 11131  |packers: $ - |came: $ 600
IPH : 8.3 JotVel: 133 IFTG: 871 379 Tanks: $ - |survey, Surface damag $ -
P{/Mf: .00/4.50 |ecp: 11.2 Hrs: 24 14.5 ]Separator: $ - Directional $ 450
Chior: 2500 |[sr#1: 30@300 |reh: 36.2 261 |neator: $ - |ows: $ 18,000
Ca : 20 ISPR #2:  40@450 WOB: 18/20 23126 IPumpIng u:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 55 IBtm.Up: 42 |r-RPM: 70/75 65/80 Prime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: IMIsc: $ - |consuitant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 70 l Total Rot. Hrs: 2145 IDaity Total: $ - |Driting Mud: $ 3,000
06:00 10:00 4:00 |Trip For Bit Misc. / Labor: $900
10:00 15:00 5:00 |Trip in Hole - fill at shoe ,10stds off btm,install Rhead Csg. Crew: $ -
15:00 15:30 0:30 |Break in bit ream 46" to btm Daily Total: $ 77,000
15:30 06:00 14:30 |Drig f/ 11131 - 11510 (379'@26.1fph) Cum. Wir: $ 18,600
06:00 Cum. Fuel $ 103,500
0 Cum. Bits: $ 62,000
0 RECEIVED BHA
0 Y Bits: 1.00
0 (UMY m’ [Bit sub 3.18
0 R [Mones 31.05
0 DIV, OF OIL, GAS & TN 15-DC 61/2 463.76
0
0 Degasser 24/7
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030 -6480
0 Mesaverde 8805’ -2705'
0 Castlegate 11240 -270
0 Desert 11495’ -15" TOTAL BHA = 498.99
0 Grassy 11620" 110’ Survey 2.5 10609’
0 Sunnyside 11705’ 195' Survey
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ 680° Survey
24.00 |tp 14250° 2740° BOILER] 0 Survey
P/U 263 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 5300
S/IO 223 K# FLARE: 3" flare while on vent Gas Buster CONN GAS 5300
ROT. 246 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 5300
& Usedi 1400 On Hand: 15501 Co.Man RICK FELKER _ TRIP_GAS 5300
BIT # 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G obC RP
[ CONDITION 0 4 ot s X | wt pr
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AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22"
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/8/07 DAYS: 19
Current: Operations: Drilling
Depth: 11730’ |Prog: 220  |pHrs: 111/2  |ave rop 19.1  [Formation: Sunnyside
DMC: $3,200 ITMC: $55,000 TDC: $30,050 |cwc: $1,165,083
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
fw: 105 |#1 Pz-10=348GPS [sns: 8 9 Conductor:  $ - |Loccost: $
viS: 45 ISPM: 117 ISize: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
|pvive: 12/22 |#2 PZ-10 =3.48 GPS |rype: 5062x+ 506zx+  |int. Csg: $ - |pay Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 13/28/34 ISPM: 0 JMFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
i 17 Joem: 408 |sn: 7115675 _| 7115677 |FostEque: __ $ - |rrucking: $ -
Cake: IPress: 1400 Jots: 4x16,2x14 4x16,2x14 |well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Isotids: 13 Javpc: 384 TD Out: 11626 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet: $ -
IMBT 13.25 |avorp: 208 |Depth In: 11131 11626  JPackers: $ - |camp: $ -
IPH : 8.4 JetVel: 111 |FTG: 495 104 Tanks: $ - |survey, Surface damay $ -
PiME: .05//4.40 Jecp: 11.0 IHrs: 21 5 [separator: $ - |Directional $ 450
Chior: 2500 |sPR#1: 70@520 IFPH: 23.5 20.8 IHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ica: 20 |IsPR#2: WOB: 23/26 18/20 IPumping LT $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 6 IBtm.Up: 525 |R-RPM: 65/80 35/45 |Prime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 50/60 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,000
START END TIME 70 I Total Rot. Hrs: 229.0 IDaily Total: $ - iDrilling Mud: $ 3,200
06:00 | 08:30 2:30 |Drlg f/ 11510 - 11562 (52" @20.8fph) Misc. / Labor: $0
08:30 9:00 0:30 |Survey Csg. Crew: $ -
9:00 13:00 4:00 |Drlg f/ 11562 - 11626 (64’ @16fph) Daily Total: $ 30,050
13:00 14:00 1:00 |Circulate and spot pill Cum. Wir: $ 18,600
14.00 18:30 4:30 {Trip for bit Cum. Fuel $ 103,500
18:30 19:30 1:00 [Change bit, check wear bushing - ok, pick up mtr Cum. Bits: $ 62,000
19:30 00:30 5:00 |Trip in hole fill pipe @ shoe,8000,10 stds off btm,install rhead BHA
00:30 1:00 0:30 |Break in bit,wash to btm - no fill Isits: 1.00
1:00 6:00 5:00 |Drlg f/ 11626 - 11730 (104° @20.8fph) IMTR 0.13 30.88
0 18 wt on bit,- 35/40 rpm [Monel 31.05
0 15-DC 61/2 467.76
0 DO
0 Degasser 24/7 NEULIVLD
Depth Feet To Go arTin 7
0 Wasatch 5030° -6700° 0CH-0-2007
0 Mesaverde 8805' -2925' DIV-OF-OIL GAS & MINING
0 Castlegate 11240’ -490°
0 Desert 11495’ -235' TOTAL BHA = 530.69
0 Grassy 11620’ -110' Survey 2.8 11465'
0 Sunnyside 11705’ -25' Survey
0 Spring Canyor  12190° 460" Survey
24.00 |p 14250° 2520' BOILER] 0 Survey
P/U 295 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 4200
SI0 255 K# FLARE: 3’ flare while on vent Gas Buster no CONN GAS 4400
JROT. 270 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 4400
|FUEL Used: 1275 On Hand: 14226 C&Man RICK FELKER TRIP EAS 4400
BIT # 8 ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 1 2 ct s X ] wt pr
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ST arE A2 AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/9/07 DAYS: 20
Current: Operations: Circulating
Depth: 12106’ |Prog: 376 [DHrs: 11 lave roP 34.2  |rormation: Sunnyside
DMC: $3,800 ITMC: $58,800 TDC: $80,650 JCwC: $1,245,733
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
fMw: 15 |#1 Pz-10=3438GPS |Bit #: 9 Conductor: $ - Jroc,cost: $
VIS: 45 SPM: 117 ISlze: 77/8 Jsurt. csg: $ - |rig Move: $ -
Ipvive: 10/18 |#2 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |Type: 5062x+ Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 11/26/32 |spwm: 0 |mra: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
wL: 17 GPM : 408 ISIN: 7115677 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: IPress: 1400 Jots: 4x16,2x14 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 13 AV DC: 384 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuer $ -
ImBT 13.25 JavDp: 208 IDepth In: 11626 [Packers: $ - CAMP: $ -
IPH : 8.0  |uetvel 111 IFTG: 408 Tanks: $ - |survey, Surface damag $ -
IPfIMf: .00/4.00 Jecp: 10.96 IHrs: 16 |Separator: $ - |pirectional $ 450
Chior: 2500 ISPR #1: 70@520 IFPH: 25.5 IHeator: $ - Bits: $ 39,000
Ca : 20 ISPR #2:  60@300 WOB: 23/26 lPumpIng L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,000
IDapp ppb: 55 IBtm.Up: 54 |r-RPM: 35/45 Prime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 50/60 IMlsc: $ - |consultant: $ 2000
START END TIME 70 I Total Rot. Hrs: 246.0 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 3,800
06:00 | 17:.00 | 11:00 JDrigf/11730 - 12106 (376’ @34.2fph) Misc. / Labor: $8,000
17.00 18:00 1:00 |Circulate - pump dry job Csg. Crew: $ -
18:00 | 21:00 3:00 |Wiper Trip to shoe Daily Total: $ 80,650
21:00 01:00 4:00 [Trip in Hole Cum. Wtr: $ 18,600
01:00 | 03:00 2:00 |Wash to Bitm -no fill circulate gas out Cum. Fuel $ 103,500
03:00 | 04:00 1:00 |Survey Cum. Bits: $ 108,000
04:00 6:00 2:00 [Circulate BHA
6:00 RFECEIVED Iits: 1.00
0 | 0.13 30.88
0 UCT UL ZUW [monei 31.05
0 15-DC 6 1/2 467.76
0 DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
0 Degasser 24/7
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030 -7076'
0 JMesaverde 8805 -3301'
0 Castlegate 11240’ -866'
0 Desert 11495’ -611' TOTAL BHA = 530.69
0 Grassy 11620’ -486' Survey 2.8 11465’
0 Sunnyside 11705’ -401°' Survey 2.5 12063
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ 84' Survey
24.00 [t 14250' 2144° BOILER]| 0 Survey
P/IU 298 K# LITH: Centrifuge BKG GAS 2300
S/I0 258 K# FLARE: 3’ flare while on vent Gas Buster no CONN GAS 4100
ROT. 278 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 4100
IFUEL Used: 1189 On Hand: 13046 Co.Man RICKFELKER TRlliGAS 4100
BIT # 8 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
| CONDITION 1 2 ct s X | wt pr
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Energy o/ 3~097- 39190
/9779 2/ -32.3 AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/10/07 DAYS: 21
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: _ 12,750' JProg: 644 b Hrs: 20 |ave roP 32.2  |Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $1,300 |TMC: $60,100 TDC: $34,150 Jcwc: $1,279,883
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 10.6 |#1 PZ-10=348GPS |eits: 9 Conductor:  $ - |Loc,cost $
vIS: 38 ISPM: 65 Size: 77/8 Jsurf. Csg: $ - |Rrig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 9/13 I#Z PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS [Type: 5062x+ Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 921 |sem: 65 |mra: HTC IProd Csg: $ - [Rental Tools: $ 2,400
wL: 17.6  JePm: 452 SIN: 7115677 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 2 IPress: 2266 Jets: 4x16,2x14 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,000
|sotids: 12 AV DC: 384 TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
IMBT 13.25 Javoe: 208 [Depth In: 11626 Packers: $ - |camp: $ -
LPH : 8.2 JetVel: 111 IFTG: 1124 Tanks: $ - [Survey, Surface damag $ -
P{Mf: .00/4.50 [eco: 10.96 IHrs: 36 |Separator: $ - |oirectional 3 450
Chior: 2900 lSPR #:  70@520 FPH: 31.0 IHealer: $ - |sits: $
Ca : 40 ISPR #2: 60@300 WOB: 26/28 IPumpIng LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2000
Dapp ppb: 5 IBtm.Up: 50 |R-RPM: 45/50 Prime Mover:  $ - |BOPTest $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 56 |msc: $ - |consuttant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 70 | Total Rot. Hrs: 246.0 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,300
6:00 10:00 4  [Wait on orders Misc. / Labor: $
10:00 | 06:00 20 |Drilling from 12,106' to 12,750' ROP = 32.20" Csg. Crew: $ -
Daily Total: $ 34,150
Cum. Wtr: $ 20,600
(WENT THRU GAS DETECTOR & GO THRU GAS BUSTER 24/7) Cum. Fuel $ 103,500
Cum. Bits: $ 108,000
BHA
RECE‘VEU isns: 1.00
“n MTR 0.13 30.88
0 OCT 02067 [bone 31.05
0 A 15-DC 6 1/2 467.76
0 DIV. OF OIC GAS SIMNING
0
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030 #VALUE!
0 Mesaverde 8805' #VALUE!
0 Castlegate 11240’ #VALUE!
0 Desert 11495’ #VALUE! TOTAL BHA = 530.69
0 Grassy 11620" #VALUE! Survey 2.8 11465’
0 Sunnyside 11705’ #VALUE! Survey 2.5 12063'
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ #VALUE! Survey
24.00 |to 14250°  #VALUE! BOILER] 0 Survey
P/U 298 K# DEGASSER: RUN 24/7 Centrifuge BKG GAS 2587
SIO 258 K# FLARE: 3'TO 5" FLARE Gas Buster YES CONN GAS 3058
ROT. 278 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8” SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 3740
& Used: 1722 On Hand: 11324 Co.Man JIMWEIR TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 9 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G 0oDC RP
| CONDITION
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Energy 4.3 -0y~ 39/70
STET. 5 2/)-22 AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22"
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/11/07 DAYS: 22
Current: Operations: POOH DUE TO DECREASE IN ROP
Depth:  13229' |Prog: 479  |pHrs: 16 |ave rop 29.9  |Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $5,000 [Tme: $65,100 TDC: $38,017 [cwe: $1,317,900
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jaw: 10.6 I#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |sit#: 9 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
vIS: 43 ISPM: 65 ISIze: 77/8 |surt. csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
pvive: 10/22 I#Z PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |1ype: 5062x+ Ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 1129 |sem: 65 |mFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
wL: 20 GPM : 452 ISIN: 7115677 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
kCake: 2 IPress: 2600 Jets: 4x16,2x14 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 1,567
ISoIIds: 11 AV DC: 380 TD Out: 13229 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel:
[mer 125 |avor: 316 |oeptnin: | 11626 [Packers: $ - lcawe: $ 600
IPH : 8.2 JetVel: 118 IFTG: 1603 Tanks: $ - |survey, Surface damag $ -
Pf/Mf: .00/4.30 Jeco: 11.18 IHrs: 52 Separator: $ - Directional $ 450
Chlor: 3000 ISPR #:  70@520 IFPH: 30.8 |Heater: $ - |sits: $
Ca : 40 ISPR #2: 60@300 WOB: 28/34 IPumping ur:  $ - [Mud Motors: $§ 2,000
Dapp ppb: 4.75 IBtm.Up: 53 |R-RPM: 40/55 [Prlme Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 50/58 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 70 r Total Rot. Hrs: 246.0 IDaily Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $ 5,000
6:00 14:00 8 |DRILL F/12,750' TO 13,017' ROP=33.37" Misc. / Labor: $
14:00 | 15:00 1 [WIRE LINE SURVEY WAS 2.6 AZ 157.5 @ 12,926’ Csg. Crew: $ -
15:00 | 20:30 55 |DRILL F/13,017' TO 13,175' ROP = 28.72' Daily Total: $ 38,017
20:30 21:00 5 SERVICE RIG Cum. Wir: $ 22,167
21:00 | 23:30 25 |DRILL F/13,175' TO 13,229' ROP = 21.6' Cum. Fuel $ 103,500
23:30 | 00:30 1 JPOOH DUE TO DECREASE IN ROP Cum. Bits: $ 108,000
00:30 | 01:00 0.5 |PULL ROTATING HEAD BHA
01:00 | 06:00 5 |SLUG D.P. & CONT. POOH FOR BIT & MOTOR IBits: 1.00
Intr 0.13 30.88
0 Monel 31.05
o\ v v ey PR 15-DC 61/2 467.76
0 nReveEivey
: BET-H-2067
Depth Feet To Go !
0 Wasatch 5030° -8199' M OE AL OAS R MINIALS
0 Mesaverde 8805' -4424' b akihiie
0 Castlegate 11240 -1989°
0 Desert 11495' -1734° TOTAL BHA = 530.69
0 Grassy 11620 -1609' Survey 2.8 11465
0 Sunnyside 11705’ -1524' Survey 2.5 12063’
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ -1039' Survey 2.6 12926'
24.00 |ro 14250' 1021’ BOILER] 0 Survey
iP/U 298 K# DEGASSER: RUN 24/7 Centrifuge BKG GAS 4350
S$/0 258 K# FLARE: Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 4893
IROT. 278 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET@ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 5050
|FUEL Used: 1500 On Hand: 9824 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 9 ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP

| CONDITION
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g;l jc;,_r [9-225 AFE # 70201 GPS- 3%{3%'27?:5?"10’?43/222%
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/12/07 DAYS: 23
Current: Operations: RIH WITH NEW BIT
[Depth: _ 13248' |Prog: 19  |oHrs: 212 Jave ROP 7.6 Jrormation: MANCOS
lomc: $2,800 [rmc: $67,900 TDC: $35,500 Jcwc: $1,353,400
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 10.7_|#1 Pz-10=348GPs_|ens: 10 11 |cona $ - |Loccost: $
vis: 39 |sm: 65 |Isize: 77/8 77/8 ISurf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
fpvive: 8/22 |#2 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |Type: UD 513 505ZX Ilnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 10/19 |]spm: 65 MFG: UD 513 HTC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2400
wL: 20 GPM : 452 fsm: 3686 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 550
Cake: 3 |Press: 2600 Jots: 6X18 6X16 [Well Head: $ - |water: $
Isolids: 12 AV DC: 380 TD Out: 13248 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $
[mer 125 |avoe: 316 Ipeptnin: | 13229 13248 |packers: $ - |came: $
IPH : 8.2 JotVel: 118 IFTG: 19 Tanks: $ - |survey, Surface dama¢ $ -
PIMS: .00/5.30 |ecp: 11.18 IHrs: 2.5 |Separator: $ - Directional $ 450
Chior: 3200 ISPR #:  70@520 IFPH: 7.6 IHeater: $ - Bits: $
lca - 40 ISPR #2: 60@300 WOB: 20/35 IPumping ur:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ 300
lDapp ppb: 4,75 lBtm.Up: 53 |r-rPM: 30/65 IPrIme Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-rem: 45/60 Iisc: $ - |consutant: $ 1,300
START END TIME 70 I Total Rot. Hrs: 282.0 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,800
6:00 06:30 .5 JCONTINUE POOH FOR BIT Misc. / Labor: $4,700
06:30 08:30 2 [M/U BIT,DOG SUB, TORQUE BUSTER, NEW MOTOR, & RIH TO SHOE Ing. Crew: $ -
08:30 09:30 1 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE & BREAK CIRC. |Daily Total: $ 35,500
09:30 14:00 4.5 |CONT. RIH BREAK CIRC. @ 8,000 & 12,000" & INSTALL ROTATING HEAD ICum. Wir: $ 22,167
14:00 15:30 1.5 |REAM & WASH DOWN F/13,068' TO 13,248' ICum. Fuel $ 103,500
15:30 18:00 2.5 |DRILL F/13,229' TO 13,248' UNABLE TO GET BIT TO DRILL lcum. sits: $ 108,000
ROP =7.8' BHA
18:00 18:30 .5 |MIX SLUG & PUMP SAME IBits: 1.00
18:30 01:30 7 POOH FOR BIT & PULL ROTATING HEAD |ooc sus 0.50
01:30 02:00 5 |L/D BIT,DOG SUB, TORQUE BUSTER & MM T.B. 7.24
02:00 06:00 4:00 |P/U NEW MM & BIT & RIH. BREAK CIRC. @ 5,000' fMm 30.86
0 ImoNEL 31.05
15-DC 467.76
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030' -8218'
0 |Mesaverde 8805' -4443'
0 Castlegate 11240' -2008' REOIVED
0 Desert 11495’ -1753' TOTAL BHA = 538.41
0 Grassy 11620° -1628" OCT V22007  [survey 28] 11465
0 Sunnyside 11705’ -1543' Survey 2.5 12063’
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ -1058' DIV OF UL, GAS & MINING [survey 260 12926
24.00 |rp 14250° 1002 BOILER] 0 Survey
jP/U 298 K# DEGASSER: RUN 24/7 Centrifuge BKG GAS 4350
S/I0 258 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 4893
IROT. 278 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8™ SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 5050
IFUEL Used: 885 On Hand: 8939 Mn JIM WEIR TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 10 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| CONDITION 1 1 N/A NONE X I NONE PR
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Energy Y3-0Y9~-29/70
AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22"
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/113/2007 DAYS: 24
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth:  13657' |Prog: 409  |p Hrs: 18 |ave roP 22.7  |Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $3,900 [TMC: $71,800 TDC: $33,700 |cwe: $1,387,100
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drig. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jaw: 10.7 |#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |Bit#: 10 11 Conductor: $ - [Loc,Cost: $
vis: 45  |sem: 65 |size: 77/8 77/8  [lsurt.csg: $ - |rig move: $ -
|PViYP: 9/34 I#2 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |Type: UD 513 5052X |Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 10/29 [sem: 65 |mFG: uUD 513 HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 2,400
WL 20 GPM : 452 ISIN: 3686 7113126 |Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: 3 |Pross: 2600 Jots: 6X18 6X16 Well Hoad: $ - |water: $ 650
Solids: 12 AV DC: 380 TD Out: 13248 in hole  |TBGIRods: $ - |Fuen $
|mBT 12.5 |avpp: 316 |Depth in: 13229 13248  |packers: $ - |camp: $
IPH : 8.0 JetVel: 118 IFTG: 19 409 Tanks: $ - |survey, Surface dama; $ -
P/Mf: .00/5.90 Jeco: 11.18 IHrs: 2.5 18 |separator: $ - Directional $ 450
Chior: 3500 ISPR #1: [epn: 7.6 23.0 IHeater: $ - |sits: $
Ca : 40 lSPR #2:  55@600 WOB: 20/35 26/34 IPumping LT $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,000
Dapp ppb: 5.25 IBtm.Up: 53 |R-RPM: 30/65 40/65 IPrime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 45/60 64/75 lMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME 72 I Total Rot. Hrs: 300.0 IDain Total: $ - |oritiing Mua: $ 3,900
6:00 08:30 2.5 |CONTINUE RIH INSTALL ROTATRING HEAD Misc. / Labor: $
08:30 09:00 .5 |WASH & REAM F/13,200' TO 13,248' (NO FILL) Csg. Crew: $ -
09:00 13:00 4 DRILL F/13,248' TO 13,309' ROP=15.25" Daily Total: $ 33,700
13:00 13:30 .5 |SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE Cum. Wtr: $ 22,767
13:30 15:30 2 DRILL F/13,309' TO 13,337 ROP=14’ Cum. Fuel $ 103,500
15:30 16:00 5 SERVICE RIG Cum. Bits: $ 108,000
16:00 18:00 2 (BOTH PUMPS DOWN RIG ON DOWN TIME. WORK PIPE) BHA
18:00 | 06:00 12 |DRILL F/13,337' TO 13,657" ROP=27' Isits: 1.00
(Good drlg break @ 13,380-83 & 397-399 gas 9000 units)
GO THRU GAS BUSTER DUE TO GAS BLOWING MUD OUT OF
POSSUM BELLY @ SHAKERS. jmm 35.49
0 [moneL 31.05
0 (GO THRU GAS BUSTER @ 21;00 hrs.) 15-DC 467.76
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030' -8627' ety pr—r
0 Mesaverde 8805' -4852' HELIIVELDU
0 Castlegate 11240 2417 M’
0 Desert 11495’ -2162' ’ TOTAL BHA = 535.30
0 Grassy 11620 -2037° L Ae Al DA 9 MIKINCG [Survey 2.8] 11465
0 Sunnyside 11705' -1952' R 25| 12063
0 Spring Canyor  12190' -1467" Survey 2.6 12926
24.00 |tD 14250° 593" BOILER| 0 Survey
PIU 298 K# DEGASSER: RUN 24/7 Centrifuge BKG GAS 4350
SIO 258 K# FLARE: YES 12' TO 16’ Gas Buster YES CONN GAS 4893
ROT. 278 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 9300
FUEL Used: 885 On Hand: 8939 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 10 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
[ CONDITION 1 1 N/A NONE X | NONE PR
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STHIF R ~32, AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22"
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/14/07 DAYS: 25
Current: Operations: T.D. WELL & SHORT TRIP
Depth: 14248' |Prog: 591 ID Hrs: 21 IAVG ROP 28.1 IFormation: MANCOS
DMC: $4,100 |TMC: $75,900 TDC: $49,450 |cwcC: $1,436,550
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
faw: 10.7 |#1 pz10=348GPS |sits: 10 11 Conductor:  $ - |Loccost: $
VIS: 44 |spm: 65 Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: -
Ipvive: 7/48 I#2 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS [1ype: UD 513 505ZX  |int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 17/37  |spm: 65  |wrG: uUD 513 HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,500
WL: 20 GPM : 452 Ism: 3686 7113126 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $
Cake: 3 |press: 2750 Jots: 6X18 6X16  lwell Head: $ - |water: $ 500
|sotids: 16 AV DC: 380 TD Out: 13248 14248  ]rBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $
IMBT 15 lavoe: 316 JDepth In: 13229 13248  Ppackers: $ - |camp: $
IPH : 8.0 JetVel: 118 IFTG: 19 1000 Tanks: $ - Survey, Surface damag $ -
PIMI: .00/6.60 Jeco: 11.18 |Hrs: 25 39 |separator: $ - |pirectional 3 450
Chior: 3500 |spr#1: fren: 7.6 257 |Hoster: $ - lous: $ 9,000
Ca : 40 ISPR #2: 55@600 WOB: 20/35 26/34 IPumping uUT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,000
Dapp ppb: 5.25 IBtm.Up: 56 |r-reM: 30/65 40/65 IPrime Mover:  $ - |BoP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 45/60 64/75 IMIsc: $ - [consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME 72 I Total Rot. Hrs: 3215 IDain Total: $ - |Drilting Mud: $ 4,100
6:00 15:30 9.5 |DRILL F/13,657' TO 13,976' ROP=33.58' Misc. / Labor: $5,600
15:30 16:00 .5 |SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -
16:00 03:30 11.5 |DRILL F/13,976' TO 14,248 ROP=23.70' Daily Total: $ 49,450
03:30 05:30 2 CIRC. HI VIS PILL AROUND Cum. Wtr: $ 22,767
05:30 | 06:00 .5 |SHORT TRIP Cum. Fuel $ 103,500
Cum. Bits: $ 117,000
BHA
|Bits: 1.00
[ 35.49
[moneL 31.05
15-DC 467.76
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030’ -9218' oo riven
0 Mesaverde 8805" -5443' Pttt
0 Castlegats 11240° -3008' 0CT 15 2007
0 Desert 11495’ -2753' TOTAL BHA = 535.30
0 Grassy 11620’ -2628' e 388 & MINING  [survey 2.8  11465'
0 Sunnyside 11705’ -2543' Survey 2.5 12063
0 Spring Canyor 12190’ -2058' Survey 2.6 12926’
24.00 J1o 14250° 2 BOILER| 0 Survey
P/U 298 K# DEGASSER: RUN 24/7 Centrifuge BKG GAS 4050
SI0 258 K# FLARE: VENT NO FLARE Gas Buster NO CONN GAS 5400
ROT. 278 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8” SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 5570
E& Used: 885 On Hand: 8939 Co.Man JIMWEIR TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 10 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
| CONDITION 1 1 N/A NONE X [ NONE PR
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‘ DAILY DRILLING REPORT Ki9g S-3o
Energy WG30Y— G100
57_/9.7:‘ '5/-32 AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109'48'25.22

Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/15/07 DAYS: 26
Current: Operations: LOGGING WELL
Depth:  14248' |Prog: 591  |pHrs: 21 |ave rROP 28.1  |Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $2,800 |TMC: $78,700 TDC: $31,050 jcwc: $1,467,600
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.7 |1 PZ-10=3.48 GPS [Bit#: 10 11 Conductor: $ - |roc,Cost: $
VIS: 44 SPM: Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rrig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 7/48 #2 PZ-10 =3.48 GPS |1ype: UD 513 505ZX  |int.Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Get: 17137  |sPm: MFG: UD 513 HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3,500
WL: 20 GPM : fsm: 3686 7113126 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: 3
Cake: 3 IPress: Jets: 6X18 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $
Solids: 16 Javbc: TD Out: 13248 14248  |TBGIRods: $ - |Fuet $
lMBT 15 AV DP: |pepth in: 13229 13248  lPackers: $ - |camp: $
PH : 8.0 JetVel: IFTG: 19 1000 Tanks: $ - |survey, Surface dama¢ $ -
PiMf: .00/6.60 Jecp: IHrs: 2.5 39 Separator: $ - |pirectional $ 450
Chior: 3500 |spr#t: FPH: 7.6 25.7 Heater; $ - |sits: $
ca : 40 SPR#2 : WOoB: 20/35 26/34  lpumpingur:  § - |Mud Motors: $
|Dapp ppb: 5.25 Btm.Up: iR-RPM: 30/65 40/65 Prime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ . -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 45/60 64/75 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME 72 I Total Rot. Hrs: 321.5 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,800
6:00 07:00 1 CONT. SHORT TRIP TO 13,100' (NO TIGHT HOLE) Misc. / Labor: $
07:00 10:00 3 CIRC. OUT GAS THRU GAS BUSTER Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 10:30 .5 |DROP SURVEY TOOL & PUMP SLUG Daily Total: $ 31,050
10:30 16:00 55 |POOH TO LOG WELL. L/D MONEL & MUD MOTOR Cum. Wtr: $ 22,767
16:00 19:30 1.5 |R/U BAKER ATLAS LOGGERS Cum. Fue! $ 103,500
19:30 00:30 7 |RIHW/TRIPLE COMBO, LOGS ON BOTTOM @ 19:00 HRS. Cum. Bits: $ 117,000
00:30 02:30 L/D TOOLS & P/U OTHER TOOLS BHA
02:30 | 06:00 35 JRIHW/STAR LOGGING TOOLS ON BOTTOM WITH SECOND IBits: 1.00
RUN @ 04:00 A.M. es.
(BIT LOOKED LIKE NEW ONE CUTTER SLIGHTLY WORN) 15-DC 467.76
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030’ -9218" e e o e 1% T S
0 Mesaverde 8805" -5443' RECEIVED
0 Castlegate 11240’ -3008' netT 1K zge7
0 Desert 11495' -2753' oLl R TOTAL BHA = 468.76
0 Grassy 11620’ -2628' ~oo RNING |Survey 2.8] 11465
0 Sunnyside 11705' -2543" CT R survey 25| 12063
0 Spring Canyor 12190" -2058' Survey 2.6 12926
24.00 ITD 14250" 2' BOlLERI 0 Survey 3.2 14186'
P/U 298 K# DEGASSER: RUN 24/7 Centrifuge BKG GAS 4050
SIO 258 Ki# FLARE: 10°'TO0 12 Gas Buster YES CONN GAS 5400
ROT. 278 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 5570
FUEL Used: 700 On Hand: 12128 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 11 ICS 0OCS DC LOC B/S G 0oDC RP
I CONDITION 1 1 N/A NONE X | NONE TD
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| DAILY DRILLING REPORT 7/0 75 ‘ l%‘ S
Energ;; Hz~047-39 %0
S+0rE A - 22 AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.95" 109°'48'25.22
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/16/07 DAYS: 27
Current: Operations: Lay down drill collars
Depth:  14248' |prog: Jo Hrs: |ave RoP #DIV/0!  |Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $2,500 |TMC: $81,200 TDC: $62,900 jcwc: $1,530,500
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
fw: 10.6 |#1 Pz-10=348GPS |gits: 11 RR11  lconductor:  § - Jioccost $
ViS: 42 SPM: ISize: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
Ievivp: 7/48 |#2 PZ-10 =3.48 GPS |1ype: 505ZX 505ZX  |int. Ccsg: $ - Day Rate: $ 23,000
Gel: 17/37 |spm: IMFG: HTC HTC IProd Csg: $ - [Rental Tools: $ 3,500
w: 20 fopm: SN: 7113126 | 7113126 [FioatEqup: __$ - [rrucking: $
Cake: 3 JPress: Jets: 6X18 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 16 Javbc: TD Out: 14248 14248  |TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuer $
|mBT 15 AV DP: |Depth In: 13248 14248  |Packers: $ - |came: $ 600
IPH : 8.0 JetVel: IFTG: 1000 0 Tanks: $ - Survey, Surface damag $ -
leIMf: .00/6.60 |ecb: |Hrs: 39 0 Separator: $ - |eLectricLoGeing  $ 32,000
Chlor: 3500 ISPR #: IFPH: 25.7 0.0 [Heater: $ - |Bits: $
Ca : 40 ISPR #2: WOB: 26/34 0 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $
IDapp ppb: 5.25 IBtm.Up: R-RPM: 55/65 45 |Prime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 60/75 N/A 'Misc: $ - lConsuttant: $ 1,300
START END TIME 72 I Total Rot. Hrs: 3215 lDain Total: $ - IDrilling Mud: $ 2,500
6:00 09:00 3 LOG WELL & POOH W/STAR LOGGING TOOL Misc. / Labor: $
09:00 10:00 1 RIG DOWN BAKER ATLAS Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 12:00 2 RIH TO 5,000 BREAK CIRC. Daily Total: $ 62,900
12:00 13:00 1 SERVICE RIG Cum. Wir: $ 22,767
13:00 17:00 4 |CONT. RIH BREAK CIRC. @ 10,000' & 13,000" Cum. Fuel $ 103,500
17:00 | 20:30 3.5 |CIRC. OUT GAS THRU GAS BUSTER & PUMP HI VIS PILL Cum. Bits: $ 117,000
AROUND BHA
20:30 06:00 9.5 |PUMP SLUG & POOH LAYING DOWN DRILL PIPE. L/D 13,711' OF |Bits: 1.00
DRILL PIPE & ON DRILL COLLARS @ 06:00 HRS. (EXCELLENT B.S.
JOB ON NABORS LAYING DOWN DRILL PIPE) 15-DC 467.76
Depth Feet To Go
0 Wasatch 5030' -9218' ool et g1V =l
0 Mesaverde 8805' -5443' NnEVLivkw
0 Castlegate 11240’ -3008' O‘GT_"_G_M’
0 Desert 11495 -2753' ' TOTAL BHA = 468.76
0 Grassy 11620" -2628' DN_QE_O[L'_GAS_&_MMN_G Survey 2.8 11465’
0 Sunnyside 11705’ -2543' Survey 2.5 12063'
0 Spring Canyor  12190' -2058' Survey- 2.6 12926'
24.00 |0 14250' 2 BOILER]| 0 Survey 32| 14186
P/U 298 K# DEGASSER: RUN 24/7 Centrifuge BKG GAS 0
SIO 258 Ki# FLARE: 10'TO 12 Gas Buster YES CONN GAS 0
ROT. 278 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 8700
FUEL Used: 984 On Hand: 11144 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 11 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G OoDC RP
| cCOnDITION 1 1 N/A NONE X I NONE TD




GASCO
7877 Osa

GASCO ENERGY LU
DAILY DRILLING REPORT 7 075K
AFE # 70201 GPS- 33{ o eal T dd 1P

77 S-32-

Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/17/07 DAYS: 28
Current: Operations: RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER & CLEAN MUD PITS
Depth:  14248' |Prog: o Hrs: |ave ropP #DIV/0! |rormation: MANCOS
DMC: $0 [Tmc: $81,200 TDC: $461,100 |cwe: $1,991,600
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
[raw: 10.6 I#1 PZ-10 = 3.48 GPS |Bit#: 11 RR11 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $
ViS: 42 SPM: ISize: 778 77/8  |surf.csg: $ - [Rig Move: $ 15,000
Ipvivp: 7/48 |#2 PZ-10 =3.48 GPS |Type: 505ZX 505ZX Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 173,000
Gel: 17137 ISPM: ~|vra: HTC HTC |Prod csg: $ 235,000 |Rental Tools: $ 3,500
WL: 20 GPM : ISIN: 7113126 7113126 IFIoat Equp: $ 6,900 |Trucking: $
Cake: 3 |Press: Jets: 6X18 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 4,500
Solids: 16 |avoc: TD Out: 14248 14248  [TBGIRods: $ - |Fuet: $
|meT 15 AV DP: __|pepth in: 13248 14248  Jpackers: $ - |came: $ 600
IPH : 8.0 JetVel: IFTG: 1000 0 Tanks: $ - |survey, Surface dama¢ $ -
IPfIMf: .00/6.60 |ecp: J-lrs: 39 0 Separator: $ - |eLecTric LOGGING $
Chlor: 3500 |spr#1: IFPH: 25.7 0.0 hHeater: $ - Cement: $
Ca : 40 SPR #2: WoB: 26/34 0 PumpingLT:  $ - |Mud Motors: $
|Dapp ppb: 5.25 |Btm.up: ~JR-RPM: 55/65 45 iPrime Mover: $ - BOP Test $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. lM-RPM: 60/75 N/A IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 1,300
START END TIME 72 J Total Rot. Hrs: 321.5 IDain Total: $ 241,900 |Driliing Mud: $ -
6:00 07:00 1 L/D DRILL COLLARS Misc. / Labor: $21,300
07:00 07:30 .5 |PULL WEAR BUSING OK NO WEAR Csg. Crew: $ -
07:30 09:30 2 |R/U CASING CREW & HOLD PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING Daily Total: $ 461,100
09:30 16:00 6.5 [M/U SHOE JT & FLOAT COLLAR & RIH W/4-1/2" P-110 15.10 LBS/FT Cum. Wir: $ 27,267
TO 5,800 Cum. Fuel $ 103,500
16:00 17:00 1 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD & BREAK @ 5,800° Cum. Bits: $ 117,000
17:00 00:00 7 CONTINUE RIH Wi/4-1/2 PROD. CSG TO 14,200' & BREAK CIRC. @ 10,000’ BHA
00:00 00:30 5 ATTEMPT TO WASH DOWN F/14,200 TO 14,238 NOT SUCCESSFUL
00:30 01:00 5 L/D 1 JT. OF CSG & CONT. CIRC. WHILE RIGGING DOWN CSG CREW
01:00 02:00 1 R/U SCHLUMBERGER CMT HEAD DROP BALL & CIRC. W/RIG PUMP & HOLD
PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING
02:00 | 05:30 12:00 [TEST CMT LINES TO 4500 PSI OK. CMT AS FOLLOWS. Pump 20 bbls H2o, 20 bbls cw
100 spacer. Pump510 sks = 276 bbls of class "G” + ADDITIVES @ 11.0 PPG YLD=3.06
CU. FT/SK. Tail in 2325 sks.=633bbls Of 50:50 Poz: Class "G" + Additives @ 14.1 ppg. Yld=1.53 cu.
ft/sk. Displace w/202 bbls 2% KCL water. Final rate =2.5 bpm @ 3650 psi. Bumped
plug to 4700 psi. Float held. Reciprocated csg thru out cmt job & had full returns.
I-RIH A TOTAL OF 339 JTS. Shoe @ 14,200' F.C. @ 14,155'
05:30 06:00 5 R/D SCHLUMBERGER TOTAL BHA = 0.00
0 H EC E !V ED Survey 2.8] 11465
0 Survey 2.5 12063
0 O e 14 290-, Survey 2.6] 12926
24.00 R BOILER| 0 Survey 32| 14186
P/U 298 K# DEGASSER: RUN24/7 DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MININGentrifuge BKG GAS 0
S/O 258 K# FLARE: 10'TO 12 Gas Buster YES CONN GAS 0
ROT. 278 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 0
FUEL Used: 984 On Hand: 11144 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 11 ICS OCs DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
| conDITION 1 1 N/A NONE X | NONE TD




CONFIDENTIA
ﬂ EPO CH 4400-B WEST ADMIRAL DOYLE DRIVE » NEW IBERIA, LOUISIANA 70560 o 337.3:{.2%322 :;x/\ f—y(.iégg ‘/{ O

October 16, 2007

State of Utah

Division of Qil, Gas, and Mining
1594 West Temple North Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re: Well Information — 21-32B-9-19

Enclosed with this letter are Mudlogs, and an Evaluation for the 21-32B-9-19 well. The
following copies are included, as per your instructions:

Description Copies
Mudiog (1” MD) 1

I would like to take this opportunity to thank you for the confidence you have shown in
our organization by allowing us to assist you on these important projects. If | can be of
any future assistance, please do not hesitate to call me at your convenience.

Most sincerely,

F oy

Kevin Romey

Gulf Coast DML Manager
337-364-2322 - Office
337-519-8428 - Cellular

" RECEIVED
0CT 18 2007
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

RLE 2% ™



GASCO

GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

CEE A 1

R|IE. S~32-

Energy AFE # 70201 GPS- 39'59'27.@(5’31061 25'._22? 7190
Well: State 21-32B-9-19 | Per.Depth 14500 | Per.Depth 14500 DATE 10/18/07 DAYS: 29
Current: Operations: FINAL REPORT
Depth: 14248 |Prog: Ip Hrs: |ave ROP #DIV/0!  [Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $0 [Tme: $81,200 TDC: $95,600 |cwe: $2,087,200
Contractor: Nabors 99 M-I Drlg. Fluids TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
M 106 |#1 Pz-10=3.48GPS_|sit#: 11 RR11__ |conductor: - Locgost $
VIS: 42 SPM: Size: 77/8 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $
PV/YP: 7/48 |#2 PZ-10 =3.48 GPS |Type: 505X 505ZX Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $4,800
Gel: 17/37  |spm: MFG: HTC HTC Prod Csg: Rental Tools: $ 3,500
WL: 20 GPM : SIN: 7113126 7113126 IFIoat Equp: Trucking: $
Cake: 3 hPress: Jets: 6X18 6X16 Well Head: $ 850 |water: $
|sotids: 16 javpc: TD Out: 14248 14248  |tBGIRods: 3 - |Fuel $
- 15 |avor: [oeptnin: | 13248 14248 |packers: $ - |cawe: $
IPH : 8.0 JetVel: IFTG: 1000 0 Tanks: $ - Survey, Surface damaq $ -
IPfIMf: .00/6.60 Jecp: Hrs: 39 0 Separator: $ - |ELECTRIC LOGGING _$
Chior: 3500 |[spr#1: FPH: 25.7 0.0 Heater: $ - Cement: $ 85,600
Ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 26/34 0 lPumpingLr:  $ - |Mud Motors: $
Dapp ppb: 5.25 IBtm.Up: iR-RPM: 55/65 45 Prime Mover: $ - |BOP Test $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 60/75 N/A IMisc: $ - |consuttant: $ 300

START END TIME 72 I Total Rot. Hrs: 321.5 IDain Total: $ 850 |Drilling Mud: $ -

6:00 06:30 5 FINISH RIGGING DOWN SCHLUMBERGER Misc. / Labor: $550

06:30 11:00 5.5 |R/D BOP & P/U SET SLIPS SET DOWN 195K IN SLIPS & CUT OFF Csg. Crew: $ -

4-1/2" CSG & L/D SAME. CLEAN MUD TANKS. Daily Total: $ 95,600
Cum. Wtr: $ 27,267
RELEASE RIG @ 11:00 HRS ON 10/17/2007 FINAL REPORT Cum. Fuel $ 103,500
Cum. Bits: $ 117,000
BHA
RECEIVED
122 2007
OV OF OIL, GAS X MINING TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey 2.8 11465
0 Survey 25 12063
0 Survey 2.6 12926’
24.00 BOILER| 0 Survey 32| 14186
PIU 298 K# DEGASSER: RUN 24/7 Centrifuge BKG GAS 0
SI/O 258 K# FLARE: 10'TO 12 Gas Buster YES CONN GAS 0
ROT. 278 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3242 KB PEAK GAS 0
FUEL Used: 984 On Hand: 11144 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS N/A
BIT # 11 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G oDC RP
| CONDITION 1 1 N/A NONE X i NONE TD




FORM 9

STATE QFUFAH P, my
DEPARTMENT OF NAT_URAL RES%%(L AL
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND.

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-45172
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NA
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to N A

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8 WELL NAME and NUMBER

o weet [J GASWELL V] OTHER State 21-32B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APl NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4304739170
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 . Englewood Co 80112 (303) 483-0044 Pariette Bench
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTaces aT surrace: 1300" FNL & 1880' FWL county:  Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDAN: NENW 32 9SS  19E STATE

UTAH

1 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) D ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

d SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELL STATUS

PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

CONVERT WELL TYPE

adoOoooagd

RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE

NOOOOOoOoo

RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

otHer: Keep records
confidential

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well was spud on 8/20/07. TD was reached on 10/14/07. At the current time this well is shut in waiting on completion.
Completion procedures have been delayed due to the low gas prices in the area. We expect to start completing this well

around 12/5/07

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)

Beverly Walker

TITLE

Engineering Technician

L dlew

10/30/2007

DATE

sioNATURK_| | wC L (1
\‘_)"

{This space for State use only)

(5/2000)

(See Instructions on Reverse Side)

RECEIVED
NOV 02 2007
DIV. OF OiL, GAS & MINING



NOTICE
Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:
+ Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log
* A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run
* A copy of drillstem test reports,
* A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations
A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled
A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for
each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: _Gasco Production Company Today’s Date: 02/14/2008

Well: API Number: Drilling Commenced:
Wilkin Ridge 43-29-10-17  drlg rpts/wcr 4301333098 02/20/2007
Gate Cyn ST 23-16-11-15  drlg rpts/wer 4301332685 04/25/2007
Federal 34-18-9-19 wcr 4304737117 07/23/2007
State 22-32A drig rpts/wcr 4304739171 08/19/2007
State 21-32B drig rpts/iwcer 4304739170 08/20/2007

s e 32

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Qil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance File



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-45172
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS G'N';'“""‘” ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

. - A A2y oy ;] 7 UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged‘welis‘ orto = 17N A
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. Phi s L

AT TR Wil WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL v OTHE ey
0 w R State 21:328
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4304739170
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 ..., Englewood seare GO - 80112 (303) 483-0044 Pariette Bench
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FooTaGes AT surrace: 1300’ FNL & 1880' FWL county.  Uintah
QTRI/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 32 9S8 19E STATE:
UTAH
1, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT [ [ L]
(Submit in Duplicate) [7] ALrercasinG [] FracTURE TREAT [] swetracK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: I___] CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION |:] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[] cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS [] operator chance [] tueinGrePAR
[] cranGe TueiNg [ ] PLucaND aBANDON [[] venTorFLare
[] suBseQuENT REPORT [] cHance weLL Nave ] prueeack [] waterDisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[] cHANGE weLL STATUS [] eropucTioN (sTARTRESUME) [] waTer shut-oFF
Date of work completion:
[[] commiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE omHer: Status update
] convertwew Tvre [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This well has been drilled to its total depth of 14,248 - completion operations have not begun yet but are expected to be started
sometime within the next month.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) _Beverly Walker mme Ehgineering Technician

SIGNATURE W(Ke// o ///// pate _2/29/2008
/ i i

(This space for State use only) RECE\VED

MAR 17 2008

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) D‘V- OF o\, GAS & MlN‘NG



P”ME ! DCMTIA
LUNT TULIY AL
RECEIVED
APR §8 2008 GASCO Production Company
i “TIGHT HOLE”
UIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING Lease: State 21-32B-9-19 (2)

Legal: 1300° FNL, 1881 FWL, Section 32-T9S-R19E
Uintah County, Utah
API: 043-047-39170

Completion: Mancos “TIGHT HOLE”

1/30/08 RU Halliburton Wireline and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray/VDL log.
Found TOC inside of surface csg.

2/12/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $19,581 CC $2,106,781

3/17/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $77,666 CC $2,184,447

3/18/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $31,356 CC § 2,215,803

3/22/08 RU B&C and pressure tested csg to 11500 psi, ok.

3/23/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC: $20,343 CC: $2,236,146

3/23/08 (Sat.) MIRU Halliburton Wireline to perforate Stage 1 — Mancos. Perf

from 14006 - 08>, 14036 - 38°, 14088 - 90°, 14127 - 30°, 3 spf, 120 deg
phased. (SCE)

3/24/08 (Easter Sun.) MIRU Bronco Oilfield Serv for flowback. (SCE)

3/26/08 RU Halliburton 11:55 AM Found 500psi SICP. Break down Mancos with
9227psi at 5 BPM. Frac Stage 1 with 500 gal of 15% HCL followed by
Slickwater. Well pressured out after pumping 5000# of 30-50 Carbo-Prop.
Left 3100# in Casing 1900# in Formation. Screened-out on 0.25PPG sand.
Bled down to 7467psi after 12 min. Made 57 bbls in 3 hrs. TR 57.
Attempt to pump in again-no good. Put well on flowback with a 10/64
choke with 7100psi. Pressure bled down quickly with minimal flowback.
Made 833 bbls in 9 %2 hrs. TR 890. BLWTR

3/27/08 RU Wireline Did not set a plug #1, due to inability to pump in stage 1.
Tag sand at 13795’ Perforate Stage 2 Mancos 13612-14, 13630-32,
13676-78, 13714-16, 13758-60, 13787-90. 3SPF 120 deg phase. Found
6751 psi SICP. Broke dn perfs @ 9126 @ 4.7 bpm. Pumped 1 'z gal
GPT throughout w/ recycled water. Frac well at 5-12-16-20-24 BPM.



4/2/08

4/3/08

4/4/08

4/7/08

Very difficult to frac. Pumped 64,700# of 30-50 Carbo-prop using 4290
bbls of 20 & 25# linear Gell. ATP 10,500psi at 21 BPM. ISIP-7562. SWI.
RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 3 — Mancos. Set CBP (#2 position)
@ 13580°. Psi tested plug to 1000 over SI. Perforated f/ 13246 — 48,
13344 — 46°, 13402 — 04°, 13499 — 502°, 3 spf. RU to frac. Broke into
perfs @ 9639 psi @ 6 bpm then psi climbed to 10000 psi. Increased rate
to 10 bpm and psi out to 11200. Dropped rate to 7 bpm for 18 min, and
pumped liner gel to perfs. Perfs pressured out to 11400 w/ gel on.
Dropped rate to 2 bpm and pressured out several more times. SWI and
moved iron to (3) State 21-32A. Can’t get any more injection into Stage 3
Total bbls pumped 235. Released Halliburton to further evaluate what
needs to be done to frac. (SCE, JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC: $45,784 CC: $ 2,281,930

RU HES coil tbg. RIH w/ 3 5/8 Blade bit+2 7/8 Even wall ECTD
motor+jars. Circulate well bore while RIH w/ 10# Flow pro using MI
Swaco. Holding 6,000 psi back psi w/ MI Swaco super auto ck and bronco
oilfield serv junk catcher. Tag plug #1 @ 13,580 drill up and saw O psi
increase. RIH tag sand fill @ 13,600° wash dn 30’ at a time and pull up
50° to spread out surface arrival. Tag PBTD @ 14,155°. Circulate
production water to replace 10# and POOH. When sand came to surface
MI Swaco plugged off had to go to bronco ck. Continue POOH holding
5,800 psi back psi w/ck. OOH RDMO Halliburton. Open well up to flow
back w/5,600 psi on a 9/64 ck. SDFN. (JD)

FB #’s 4/3/08

5:00 a.m. 6,900 psi, 9/64 ck, made 63 bbls
6:00 a.m. 6,500 ps,i 9/64 ck, made 58 bbls
7:00 a.m. 6,420 psi, 9/64 ck, made 52 bbls
8:00 a.m. 6,400 psi, 9/64 ck, made 60 bbls
9:00 a.m. 6,325 psi, 9/64 ck, made 60 bbls
10:00 a.m. 6,300 psi 9/64 ck, made 49 bbls
11:00 a.m. 6,300 psi 9/64 ck made 51 bbls
TR 1,283 bbls, 0 BLWTR

Bbls water recovered is combined and an average of all three wells. Wells
were ran through a common separator. TR 1,521 bbls, BLWTR 0. Turn
well over to first sales through its own separator. 4/5/08 w/5,215 psi on a
8/64 ck.



Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004- 0137
Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Senal No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS ML1-45172
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. 1f Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7.} Unitor CA. Ame‘;‘:’:“ame and/or No.

1. Type of Well

D Oil Well Gas Well D Other

2. Name of Operator

8. Well Name and No.

State 21-32B-9-19

Gasco Production Company
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044

9. API Well No.
4304739170

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

I300FNL& 1880 FWLpe  1ge 29

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
Pariette Bench

11. County or Parish, State
Uintah, UT

12.  CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent DAcidize DDeepen I:lProduction ( Start/ Resume) EIWater Shut-off

D Subsequent Report D Casing Repair EINew Construction DRecomp]ete

I:_—_] Altering Casing DFracture Treat I:] Reclamation

D Change Plans DPlug and abandon DTemporan’]y Abandon
DFina] Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection DPlug back Water Disposal

DWeﬂ Integrity
DOLher

13. Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA.  Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site isready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that we will be disposing of water from this well as follows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
the Desert Spring State Evaporation Facility NW 1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E
Uintah County Utah. Which is owned by Gasco Production Company.

* Acceptedbythe
' Utah Division :
oi. t:as and Mining

F%; - \...UORD ONU

I =
e

14. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed’ Typed)
, Title ] ) o
Beverly Walker™ Engineering Technician
S / . b
ignature Yy " ate .

: / }//J (L s /é,-( Apnl 7. 2008

/ 7 THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or}
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease|Office
which  would  entitle  the applicant to  conduct  operations thereon,

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and wn]lful]y IOHI:@ E)IJVE Dgency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

© APR 14 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



APR 18 2008 RERRT

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING GASCO Production Company
“TIGHT HOLE”
Lease: State 21-32B-9-19 (2)
Legal: 1300’ FNL, 1881 FWL, Section 32-T9S-R19E
Uintah County, Utah
API: 043-047-39170

Completion: Mancos “TIGHT HOLE”

1/30/08 RU Halliburton Wireline and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray/VDL log.
Found TOC inside of surface csg.

2/12/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $19,581 CC $2,106,781

3/17/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $77,666 CC $2,184,447

3/18/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $31,356 CC §$ 2,215,803

3/22/08 RU B&C and pressure tested csg to 11500 psi, ok.

3/23/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC: $20,343 CC: $2,236,146

3/23/08 (Sat.) MIRU Halliburton Wireline to perforate Stage 1 — Mancos. Perf

from 14006 - 08°, 14036 - 38°, 14088 - 90°, 14127 - 30°, 3 spf, 120 deg
phased. (SCE)

3/24/08 (Easter Sun.) MIRU Bronco Oilfield Serv for flowback. (SCE)

3/26/08 RU Halliburton 11:55 AM Found 500psi SICP. Break down Mancos with
9227psi at 5 BPM. Frac Stage 1 with 500 gal of 15% HCL followed by
Slickwater. Well pressured out after pumping 5000# of 30-50 Carbo-Prop.
Left 3100# in Casing 1900# in Formation. Screened-out on 0.25PPG sand.
Bled down to 7467psi after 12 min. Made 57 bbls in 3 hrs. TR 57.
Attempt to pump in again-no good. Put well on flowback with a 10/64
choke with 7100psi. Pressure bled down quickly with minimal flowback.
Made 833 bblsin 9 2 hrs. TR 890. BLWTR .

3/27/08 RU Wireline Did not set a plug #1, due to inability to pump in stage 1.
Tag sand at 13795’ Perforate Stage 2 Mancos 13612-14, 13630-32,
13676-78, 13714-16, 13758-60, 13787-90. 3SPF 120 deg phase. Found
6751 psi SICP. Broke dn perfs @ 9126 @ 4.7 bpm. Pumped 1 2 gal
GPT throughout w/ recycled water. Frac well at 5-12-16-20-24 BPM.



4/2/08

4/3/08

4/4/08

4/7/08

4/8/08

4/15/08

Very difficult to frac. Pumped 64,700# of 30-50 Carbo-prop using 4290
bbls of 20 & 25# linear Gell. ATP 10,500psi at 21 BPM. ISIP-7562. SWIL
RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 3 — Mancos. Set CBP (#2 position)
@ 13580°. Psi tested plug to 1000 over SI. Perforated f/ 13246 — 48,
13344 — 46°, 13402 — 04°, 13499 — 502, 3 spf. RU to frac. Broke into
perfs @ 9639 psi @ 6 bpm then psi climbed to 10000 psi. Increased rate
to 10 bpm and psi out to 11200. Dropped rate to 7 bpm for 18 min, and
pumped liner gel to perfs. Perfs pressured out to 11400 w/ gel on.
Dropped rate to 2 bpm and pressured out several more times. SWI and
moved iron to (3) State 21-32A. Can’t get any more injection into Stage 3
Total bbls pumped 235. Released Halliburton to further evaluate what
needs to be done to frac. (SCE, JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC: $45,784 CC: § 2,281,930

RU HES coil tbg. RIH w/ 3 5/8 Blade bit+2 7/8 Even wall ECTD
motor+jars. Circulate well bore while RIH w/ 10# Flow pro using MI
Swaco. Holding 6,000 psi back psi w/ MI Swaco super auto ck and bronco
oilfield serv junk catcher. Tag plug #1 @ 13,580’ drill up and saw O psi
increase. RIH tag sand fill @ 13,600’ wash dn 30’ at a time and pull up
50° to spread out surface arrival. Tag PBTD @ 14,155°. Circulate
production water to replace 10# and POOH. When sand came to surface
MI Swaco plugged off had to go to bronco ck. Continue POOH holding
5,800 psi back psi w/ck. OOH RDMO Halliburton. Open well up to flow
back w/5,600 psi on a 9/64 ck. SDFN. (JD)

FB #’s 4/3/08

5:00 a.m. 6,900 psi, 9/64 ck, made 63 bbls
6:00 a.m. 6,500 ps,i 9/64 ck, made 58 bbls
7:00 a.m. 6,420 psi, 9/64 ck, made 52 bbls
8:00 a.m. 6,400 psi, 9/64 ck, made 60 bbls
9:00 a.m. 6,325 psi, 9/64 ck, made 60 bbls
10:00 a.m. 6,300 psi 9/64 ck, made 49 bbls
11:00 a.m. 6,300 psi 9/64 ck made 51 bbls
TR 1,283 bbls, 0 BLWTR

Bbls water recovered is combined and an average of all three wells. Wells
were ran through a common separator. TR 1,521 bbls, BLWTR 0. Turn
well over to first sales through its own separator. 4/5/08 w/5,215 psi on a
8/64 ck.

Cost update: (PME) DC $246,038 CC $2,527,968
MIRU HES wireline Grand Junction. RIH w/2 %” scalloped guns 3 spf,

and HES 10k CBP. Set HES 10k CBP @ 13,577°. Reperf stage 3
Mancos III {/13,256-57°, 13,288-89°, 13,322-23’, 13,340-41°, 13,376-77,



4/16/08

4/17/08

4/18/08

13,410-11°, 13,421-22°, 13,477-48’, 13,484-85’, 13,556-57°, 3 spf 30
holes. POOH. RU HES Frac crew Grand Junction. SDFD. (JD)

Break dn perfs w/10,150 @ 5 bpm. Linear gel frac well 49,000 #’s 30/60
sand, 3,250 bbl’s 20# gel and flushed w/154 bbls. Cut job short due to
well pressure. Job called for 59,000#’s, put 49,000#’s into formation. Had
to cut flush 50 bbls short (screen out). Average psi 9,800, average rate 16
bpm. Open well up to tb @ 9:10 p.m. w/7,500 psi.

4/16/08 1:00 a.m. 7,000 psi Made 198 bbls in 3 hrs 20 min BLWTR 3,208.
RIH w/plug and guns to perf. Set HES 10k CBP @13,210’, psi test to
7,835, 1,000 over sicp. Bleed off to 6,835 psi, test good. Perf stage 4
Mancos IIII /12,664-65°, 12,684-85°, 12,742-43°, 12,806-07°, 12,856-
57°, 12,906-07°, 12,956-57°, 13,013-14°, 13,054-55°, 13,106-07°, 13,150-
52°. POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/8,320 @ 5 bpm. Linear gel frac
well w/100,500#’s 30/60 ceramic sand,4,839 bbls 20# linear gel, and
flushed w/180 bbls 10# linear gel. Well treated very tight total pump time
7 hrs. Increase rate and sand conc as formation would allow. Coat last
42,000#’s starting w/1#-1.25# w/sandwedge. Average psi @ tail end of
job 10,500 psi, average rate 22 bpm. SD. ISIP 7,732, FG 1.01 SDFD. (JD)

RU RIH w/guns. Perf stage Kennilworth/Sunnyside (Perf Only)
1/11,778’-84°, 11,784-86°,11,958-62°. SWI. SDFD. (JD)



RECEIVED
APR Zzg 2008

DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING GASCO Production Company

“TIGHT HOLE”
Lease: State 21-32B-9-19 (2)
Legal: 1300’ FNL, 1881 FWL, Section 32-T9S-R19E
Uintah County, Utah
APIL: 043-047-39170

Completion: Mancos “TIGHT HOLE”

1/30/08 RU Halliburton Wireline and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray/VDL log.
Found TOC inside of surface csg.

2/12/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $19,581 CC $2,106,781

3/17/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $77,666 CC $2,184,447

3/18/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $31,356 CC $ 2,215,803

3/22/08 RU B&C and pressure tested csg to 11500 psi, ok.

3/23/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC: $20,343 CC: $2,236,146

3/23/08 (Sat.) MIRU Halliburton Wireline to perforate Stage 1 — Mancos. Perf

from 14006 - 08°, 14036 - 38°, 14088 - 90°, 14127 - 30°, 3 spf, 120 deg
phased. (SCE)

3/24/08 (Easter Sun.) MIRU Bronco Oilfield Serv for flowback. (SCE)

3/26/08 RU Halliburton 11:55 AM Found 500psi SICP. Break down Mancos with
9227psi at 5 BPM. Frac Stage 1 with 500 gal of 15% HCL followed by
Slickwater. Well pressured out after pumping 5000# of 30-50 Carbo-Prop.
Left 3100# in Casing 1900# in Formation. Screened-out on 0.25PPG sand.
Bled down to 7467psi after 12 min. Made 57 bbls in 3 hrs. TR 57.
Attempt to pump in again-no good. Put well on flowback with a 10/64
choke with 7100psi. Pressure bled down quickly with minimal flowback.
Made 833 bbls in 9 % hrs. TR 890. BLWTR

3/27/08 RU Wireline Did not set a plug #1, due to inability to pump in stage 1.
Tag sand at 13795 Perforate Stage 2 Mancos 13612-14, 13630-32,
13676-78, 13714-16, 13758-60, 13787-90. 3SPF 120 deg phase. Found
6751 psi SICP. Broke dn perfs @ 9126 @ 4.7 bpm. Pumped 1 % gal
GPT throughout w/ recycled water. Frac well at 5-12-16-20-24 BPM.



4/2/08

4/3/08

4/4/08

4/7/08

4/8/08

4/15/08

Very difficult to frac. Pumped 64,700# of 30-50 Carbo-prop using 4290
bbls of 20 & 25# linear Gell. ATP 10,500psi at 21 BPM. ISIP-7562. SWIL.
RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 3 — Mancos. Set CBP (#2 position)
@ 13580°. Psi tested plug to 1000 over SI. Perforated f/ 13246 — 48°,
13344 — 46>, 13402 — 04°, 13499 — 502°, 3 spf. RU to frac. Broke into
perfs @ 9639 psi @ 6 bpm then psi climbed to 10000 psi. Increased rate
to 10 bpm and psi out to 11200. Dropped rate to 7 bpm for 18 min, and
pumped liner gel to perfs. Perfs pressured out to 11400 w/ gel on.
Dropped rate to 2 bpm and pressured out several more times. SWI and
moved iron to (3) State 21-32A. Can’t get any more injection into Stage 3
Total bbls pumped 235. Released Halliburton to further evaluate what
needs to be done to frac. (SCE, JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC: $45,784 CC: $ 2,281,930

RU HES coil tbg. RIH w/ 3 5/8 Blade bit+2 7/8 Even wall ECTD
motor+jars. Circulate well bore while RIH w/ 10# Flow pro using MI
Swaco. Holding 6,000 psi back psi w/ MI Swaco super auto ck and bronco
oilfield serv junk catcher. Tag plug #1 @ 13,580 drill up and saw O psi
increase. RIH tag sand fill @ 13,600° wash dn 30’ at a time and pull up
50’ to spread out surface arrival. Tag PBTD @ 14,155°. Circulate
production water to replace 10# and POOH. When sand came to surface
MI Swaco plugged off had to go to bronco ck. Continue POOH holding
5,800 psi back psi w/ck. OOH RDMO Halliburton. Open well up to flow
back w/5,600 psi on a 9/64 ck. SDFN. (JD)

FB #’s 4/3/08

5:00 a.m. 6,900 psi, 9/64 ck, made 63 bbls
6:00 a.m. 6,500 ps,i 9/64 ck, made 58 bbls
7:00 a.m. 6,420 psi, 9/64 ck, made 52 bbls
8:00 a.m. 6,400 psi, 9/64 ck, made 60 bbls
9:00 a.m. 6,325 psi, 9/64 ck, made 60 bbls
10:00 a.m. 6,300 psi 9/64 ck, made 49 bbls
11:00 a.m. 6,300 psi 9/64 ck made 51 bbls
TR 1,283 bbls, 0 BLWTR

Bbls water recovered is combined and an average of all three wells. Wells
were ran through a common separator. TR 1,521 bbls, BLWTR 0. Turn
well over to first sales through its own separator. 4/5/08 w/5,215 psi on a
8/64 ck.

Cost update: (PME) DC $246,038 CC $2,527,968
MIRU HES wireline Grand Junction. RIH w/2 %” scalloped guns 3 spf,

and HES 10k CBP. Set HES 10k CBP @ 13,577°. Reperf stage 3
Mancos 111 {/13,256-57, 13,288-89°, 13,322-23", 13,340-41°, 13,376-77°,



4/16/08

4/17/08

4/18/08

4/23/08

13,410-11°, 13,421-22°, 13,477-48’, 13,484-85°, 13,556-57°, 3 spf 30
holes. POOH. RU HES Frac crew Grand Junction. SDFD. (JD)

Break dn perfs w/10,150 @ 5 bpm. Linear gel frac well 49,000 #’s 30/60
sand, 3,250 bbl’s 20# gel and flushed w/154 bbls. Cut job short due to
well pressure. Job called for 59,000#’s, put 49,000#’s into formation. Had
to cut flush 50 bbls short (screen out). Average psi 9,800, average rate 16
bpm. Open well up to b @ 9:10 p.m. w/7,500 psi.

4/16/08 1:00 a.m. 7,000 psi Made 198 bbls in 3 hrs 20 min BLWTR 3,208.
RIH w/plug and guns to perf. Set HES 10k CBP @13,210’, psi test to
7,835, 1,000 over sicp. Bleed off to 6,835 psi, test good. Perf stage 4
Mancos IIII 1/12,664-65°, 12,684-85°, 12,742-43°, 12,806-07’, 12,856-
57, 12,906-07°, 12,956-57°, 13,013-14°, 13,054-55, 13,106-07°, 13,150-
52°. POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/8,320 @ 5 bpm. Linear gel frac
well w/100,500#’s 30/60 ceramic sand,4,839 bbls 20# linear gel, and
flushed w/180 bbls 10# linear gel. Well treated very tight total pump time
7 hrs. Increase rate and sand conc as formation would allow. Coat last
42,000#’s starting w/1#-1.25# w/sandwedge. Average psi @ tail end of
job 10,500 psi, average rate 22 bpm. SD. ISIP 7,732, FG 1.01 SDFD. (JD)

RU RIH w/guns. Perf stage Kennilworth/Sunnyside (Perf Only)
£/11,778°-84°, 11,784-86°,11,958-62°. SWI1. SDFD. (JD)

RU HES coil tbg. RIH w/3 5/8” drag bit+2 7/8”ECTD even wall motor+2
7/8” jarstcircsub+disconnect. Tag HES 10k CBP #1 @ 13,210’ drill up
and saw 1,000 psi increase. RIH tag HES 10k CBP #2 @ 13,577 drill up
and saw 200 psi increase. RIH tag PBTD @ 14,153’ circulate and POOH.
RDMO HES coil tbg. Turn well over to b.



®

CONFIDENTIAL

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS ML-45172
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. 1 Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well NA

D Oil Well

as €l ther
R [Jor

8. Well Name and No.

2.

Name of Operator

Gasco Production Company

State 21-32B-9-19
9. API Well No.

3a. Address

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
303-483-0044

4304739170
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Foorage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)

1300' FNL & 1880' FWL
30 88 3 |9&

32

Pariette Bench
11. County or Parish, State

Uintah, UT

12.  CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

DDeepen
DFracmre Treat
DNew Construction
DP]ug and abandon
DPlug back

DAcidize
I::]A]tering Casing
DCasing Repair
DChange Plans

D Convert to Injection

Notice of Intent
l__—l Subsequent Report

DFinal Abandonment Notice

[jProduction ( Start/ Resume)

DRec]amation
D Recomplete
I:]Tcmporan'ly Abandon

DWater Disposal

D Water Shut-off
I:] Well Integrity
Other

EFM Meter

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of ali pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, 2 Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been compleled Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site isready for final inspection.

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 3500) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected

and proved according to all BLM regulations.

COPY SENT TO QPERATOR
Date: 5 ZDD?
S

APPROME D

Initials:

e o TR QT&C{E

14. T hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed’ Typed)
Titl
Beverly Wa]ker - Engineering Technician
Signature /-’//v Y/ ‘ Date R
/// s S LA April 7. 2008
/ / ' THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or}
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject leasefOffice
which  would  entife  the  applicant _to  conduct _ operations __thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and wﬂl_fuRE@eh;IVE@t or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

© APR 14 2008

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



1@'&
STATE OF UTAH ivdi jrﬁ“ﬂé FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-45172
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NA
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME-
Do not use this form for proposals lo drill new wells, significantly despen existing wells below current boltom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or lo NA
drill horizontal laterals, Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL B. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
oLWELL []  GASWELL OTHER State 21-30B-5-49-
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 4304739170
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 INVERNESS DRIVE E,STE | ENGLEWOOD wme CO . 80112 (303) 483-0044 Pariette Bench
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FoOTAGES AT SURFacE: 1300' FNL & 1880' FWL county. UINTAH
OTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN: NENW 32 95  19E STATE
UTAH
1 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF: SUBMISSION ; TYPE OF ACTION
- | acioize ] oeepen [ ] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
[/l NOTICE OF INTENT
{Submit In Duplicate) [[] ALteR cAsiNG [/] FRACTURE TREAT [] siDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will starl [] casiNGREPAIR [] newconstrucTion [(] vemPORARILY ABANDON
5/21/2008 [[] cHaneE To PREVIOUS PLANS [[] orerator cHance [J vusinG rerar
[ cHance TuBING [[1 pLucAND ABANDON [] venToRrFLARE
] suBSEQUENT REPORT [J cranee weLL nave ] rueeack [] water bisposaL
{Submit Original Form Only)
[J cHanGE weLL sTATUS [] PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) [ watershur-oFF
Date of work completion’
[Z]1 commiNGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] omer:
[[] converTweLL TYPE [C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent detalls including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to complete all productive intervals in the Mancos, Meseverde and Wasatch formations and to commingle production from these intervals.
Following final stimulation, a Completion Report will be submitted.

No new surface disturbance is anticipated, If any is necessary, prior approval will be obtained.

If required, the method used to account for and to allocate production from each pool so commingled will be by individual interval hydrocarbon pore volume
calculation.

Gasco Production Company is the owner of all contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the pools, and does herewith waive it's right to the
15-day period of objection per UDOGM Rule 649-3-22(3). Gasco respectfully requests that the Division therefore accept this NO{ in tieu of the required
affidavit with regard to notification of the aforementioned owners.

Attachment: Exhibit showing the location of all well on contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the subject pools.

COPY SENT TO OPERATOR

Date:_S ¥l w:
Initials: Ké

Beverly Walker +wme Engineering Technician
"\&Lt\ Ll_L_r”\ tsw :
s @F UTAH DIVISION OF REC
OIlL, GAS, AND MIN!NG EIVED
MAY 15 2008

DATE: NS /LG[O
By- VW DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

{52000} {See Instructinns on Revarsa Side)

5/13/2008

DATE




STATE
22-32A-9-1

GASCO LEASES

[ ]

GASCO PRODUCTION CO.
STATE 21-32A-9-19 & 21-32B8-19

SEC 32-T9S-R19E
UINTA BASIN, UTAH




- CONFIDENTIAL

RECEIVED GASCO Production Company
JUN122008 ! “TIGHT HOLE”
Lease: State 21-32B-9-19
DIV. OF GiL, GAS & MINING Legal: NE NW, Section 32-T9S-R19E

Uintah County, Utah
APIL: 043-047-39170

Completion: Mancos “TIGHT HOLE”

1/30/08

2/12/08

3/17/08

3/18/08

3/22/08

3/23/08

3/23/08

3/24/08

3/26/08

3/27/08

RU Halliburton Wireline and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray/VDL log.
Found TOC inside of surface csg.

Update Costs: (PME) DC $19,581 CC $2,106,781
Update Costs: (PME) DC $77,666 CC $2,184,447
Update Costs: (PME) DC $31,356 CC § 2,215,803
RU B&C and pressure tested csg to 11500 psi, ok.
Update Costs: (PME) DC: $20,343 CC: $2,236,146

(Sat.) MIRU Halliburton Wireline to perforate Stage 1 — Mancos. Perf
from 14006 - 08°, 14036 - 38°, 14088 - 90°, 14127 - 30°, 3 spf, 120 deg
phased. (SCE)

(Easter Sun.) MIRU Bronco Oilfield Serv for flowback. (SCE)

RU Halliburton 11:55 AM Found 500psi SICP. Break down Mancos with
9227pst at 5 BPM. Frac Stage 1 with 500 gal of 15% HCL followed by
Slickwater. Well pressured out after pumping 5000# of 30-50 Carbo-
Prop. Left 3100# in Casing 1900# in Formation. Screened-out on 0.25PPG
sand. Bled down to 7467psi after 12 min. Made 57 bbls in 3 hrs. TR 57.
Attempt to pump in again-no good. Put well on flowback with a 10/64
choke with 7100psi. Pressure bled down quickly with minimal flowback.
Made 833 bbls in 9 % hrs. TR 890. BLWTR .

RU Wireline Did not set a plug #1, due to inability to pump in stage 1.
Tag sand at 13795’ Perforate Stage 2 Mancos 13612-14, 13630-32,
13676-78, 13714-16, 13758-60, 13787-90. 3SPF 120 deg phase. Found
6751 psi SICP. Broke dn perfs @ 9126 @ 4.7 bpm. Pumped 1 % gal
GPT throughout w/ recycled water. Frac well at 5-12-16-20-24 BPM.



4/2/08

4/3/08

4/4/08

4/7/08

4/8/08

4/9/08
4/10/08
4/14/08

Very difficult to frac. Pumped 64,700# of 30-50 Carbo-prop using 4290
bbls of 20 & 25# linear Gell. ATP 10,500psi at 21 BPM. ISIP-7562.
SWI. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 3 — Mancos. Set CBP (#2
position) @ 13580°. Psi tested plug to 1000 over SI. Perforated f/ 13246
-48, 13344 - 46’, 13402 - 04°, 13499 - 502’, 3 spf. RU to frac. Broke
into perfs @ 9639 psi @ 6 bpm then psi climbed to 10000 psi. Increased
rate to 10 bpm and psi out to 11200. Dropped rate to 7 bpm for 18 min,
and pumped liner gel to perfs. Perfs pressured out to 11400 w/ gel on.
Dropped rate to 2 bpm and pressured out several more times. SWI and
moved iron to (3) State 21-32A. Can’t get any more injection into Stage 3
Total bbls pumped 235. Released Halliburton to further evaluate what
needs to be done to frac. (SCE, JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC: $45,784 CC: §$ 2,281,930

RU HES coil tbg. RIH w/ 3 5/8 Blade bit+2 7/8 Even wall ECTD
motor+jars. Circulate well bore while RIH w/ 10# Flow pro using MI
Swaco. Holding 6,000 psi back psi w/ MI Swaco super auto ck and bronco
oilfield serv junk catcher. Tag plug #1 @ 13,580 drill up and saw O psi
increase. RIH tag sand fill @ 13,600 wash dn 30’ at a time and pull up
50’ to spread out surface arrival. Tag PBTD @ 14,155°. Circulate
production water to replace 10# and POOH. When sand came to surface
MI Swaco plugged off had to go to bronco ck. Continue POOH holding
5,800 psi back psi w/ck. OOH RDMO Halliburton. Open well up to flow
back w/5,600 psi on a 9/64 ck. SDFN. (JD)

FB #’s 4/3/08

5:00 a.m. 6,900 psi, 9/64 ck, made 63 bbls
6:00 a.m. 6,500 ps,i 9/64 ck, made 58 bbls
7:00 a.m. 6,420 psi, 9/64 ck, made 52 bbls
8:00 a.m. 6,400 psi, 9/64 ck, made 60 bbls
9:00 a.m. 6,325 psi, 9/64 ck, made 60 bbls
10:00 a.m. 6,300 psi 9/64 ck, made 49 bbls
11:00 a.m. 6,300 psi 9/64 ck made 51 bbls
TR 1,283 bbls, 0 BLWTR

Bbls water recovered is combined and an average of all three wells. Wells
were ran through a common separator. TR 1,521 bbls, BLWTR 0. Turn
well over to first sales through its own separator. 4/5/08 w/5,215 psi on a
8/64 ck.

Cost update: (PME) DC $246,038 CC $2,527,968
Cost update: (PME) DC $10,787 CC $2,538,755

Perforating Cost update: (PME) DC $35,286 CC $2,574,041
Prep for frac Cost update: (PME) DC $6,244 CC $2,594,836



4/15/08

4/15/08

4/16/08

4/16/08

4/17/08

4/17/08

4/18/08

4/23/08

4/23/08

5/21/08

MIRU HES wireline Grand Junction. RIH w/2 %> scalloped guns 3 spf,
and HES 10k CBP. Set HES 10k CBP @ 13,577°. Reperf stage 3
Mancos III /13,256-57°, 13,288-89°, 13,322-23°, 13,340-41°, 13,376-77°,
13,410-11°, 13,421-22°, 13,477-48°, 13,484-85°, 13,556-57°, 3 spf 30
holes. POOH. RU HES Frac crew Grand Junction. SDFD. (JD)

Cost update: (PME) DC § 14,551 CC $2,594,836

Break dn perfs w/10,150 @ 5 bpm. Linear gel frac well 49,000 #’s 30/60
sand, 3,250 bbl’s 20# gel and flushed w/154 bbls. Cut job short due to
well pressure. Job called for 59,000#’s, put 49,000#’s into formation. Had
to cut flush 50 bbls short (screen out). Average psi 9,800, average rate 16
bpm. Open well up to fb @ 9:10 p.m. w/7,500 psi

Cost update: (PME) DC $307,213 CC $2,902,049

4/16/08 1:00 a.m. 7,000 psi Made 198 bbls in 3 hrs 20 min BLWTR 3,208.
RIH w/plug and guns to perf. Set HES 10k CBP @13,210°, psi test to
7,835, 1,000 over sicp. Bleed off to 6,835 psi, test good. Perf stage 4
Mancos IIII /12,664-65°, 12,684-85°, 12,742-43°, 12,806-07°, 12,856-
57, 12,906-07°, 12,956-57°, 13,013-14°, 13,054-55°, 13,106-07°, 13,150-
52°. POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/8,320 @ 5 bpm. Linear gel frac
well w/100,500#’s 30/60 ceramic sand,4,839 bbls 20# linear gel, and
flushed w/180 bbls 10# linear gel. Well treated very tight total pump time
7 hrs. Increase rate and sand conc as formation would allow. Coat last
42,000#’s starting w/1#-1.25# w/sandwedge. Average psi @ tail end of
job 10,500 psi, average rate 22 bpm. SD. ISIP 7,732, FG 1.01 SDFD. (JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC: $7665 CC $2,909,714

RU RIH w/guns. Perf stage Kennilworth/Sunnyside (Perf Only) £/11,778’-
84’,11,784-86°,11,958-62°. SWI. SDFD. (JD)

RU HES coil tbg. RIH w/3 5/8” drag bit+2 7/8”ECTD even wall motor+2
7/8” jars+circsub+disconnect. Tag HES 10k CBP #1 @ 13,210’ drill up
and saw 1,000 psi increase. RIH tag HES 10k CBP #2 @ 13,577’ drill up
and saw 200 psi increase. RIH tag PBTD @ 14,153’ circulate and POOH.
RDMO HES coil tbg. Turn well over to fb.

Cost updates: (PME) DC $4656 CC $2,914,370

MIRU JW Operating. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @
11,680°. Perf stage-5 Desert/Grassy {/11,556-60°, 11,641-44’. POOH.
RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/5,969 @ 3 bpm. SD. ISIP 4,603 FG .84.
Calculate 9 holes open. Hybrid water frac well w/122,900# 20/40



5/22/08

5/23/08

5/24/08

5/25/08

5/27/08

5/28/08

5/29/08

5/31/08

6/3/08

Optiprop, 1,966 bbls 20# XL BHT-1 gel, and flushed w/162 bbls 10#
linear gel. SD. ISIP 4,803, FG .84. Open well up to fb @7:15 w/4,600 psi
on a 12/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

SWI @ 3:00 w/2,650 on a 12/64 ck. Made 626 bbls in 7 hr 45 min, TR
626, BLWTR 1,502. RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP
@ 11,110°. Perf stage-6 Lower Mesaverde 1/10,942-46°, 11,033-35’,
11,076-79°. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/5,457 @ 3 bpm. SD. ISIP 4,655,
FG .87. Calculate 8 holes open. Hybrid gel frac well w/6,000# 20/40
white, 75,000# 20/40 Optiprop,1,713 bbls 20# XL-BHT 1 gel, and flushed
w/151 bbls 10# linear gel. SD. ISIP 4,658, FG.87. Open well up to fb @
9:58 w/4,200 on a 12/64 ck to flow bottoms up. SWI @ 4:00 p.m. w/3,200
on a 12/64 ck. Made 508 bbls in 6 hr’s, TR 1,134 bbls, BLWTR 2,855
bbls. RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @ 10,790°, Perf
stage-7 Lower Mesaverde £/10,660-62°, 10,738-41°, 10,764-68°. POOH.
SWI. SDFN. (JD)

RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/5,237 @ 3.7 bpm. SD. ISIP 4,631, FG .88.
Hybrid gel frac well w/11,300# 20/40 white, 139,000# 20/40
Optiprop,2,765 bbls 20# XL BHT-1 gel, and flushed w/150 bbls 10# linear
gel. SD. ISIP 4,746, FG .89. Open well up to ftb 10:30 a.m. w/4,600 on a
12/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

SWI @ 7:00 a.m. w/3,200 on a 12/64 ck. Made 784 bbls in 9 hrs 55 min,
TR 2,174 bbls, BLWTR 4,733 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 4,150 on a 12 ck, TR 1,039, BLWTR 5,517 bbls.

2,500 on a 12/64 ck. Made 2,086 bbls in 48 hrs, TR 3,125 bbls, BLWTR
3,782 bbls.

SWI @ 3:00 w/2,050 psi on a 12/64 ck. Made 332 bbls in 20 hrs, TR
3,457, BLWTR 3,450.

WSI waiting on sand for frac.

RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k magnum FTFP @ 10,580°. Perf stage
8 Lower mesaverde {/10,562-65°, 10,505-08°, 10,420-23°, 10,331-34°.
POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perf w/7,215 @ 6 bpm. SD. ISIP 4,641 FG
.89. Calculate holes open 14. Hybrid gel frac well w/15,300# 20/40 white,
188,00# 20/40 Optiprop,3,588 bbls 20# XL BHT-1 gel and flushed w/142
bbls 10# linear gel. SD. ISIP 4,643 FG .89. SWI. SDFD. (JD)

RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @ 9,030°. Perf stage-
9 Dark Canyon {/8,971-74’, 9,005-08. RU to frac. Break dn perfs
w/4,900 @ 3.3 bpm. SD. ISIP 3,753 FG .85. Calculate holes open 8. XL



6/4/08

6/5/08

6/6/08

6/11/08

6/12/08

BHT-1gel frac well w/44,300# 20/40 white, 50,600# 20/40 Optiprop,
1,529 bbls 20# XL. BHT-1 gel, and flushed w/129 bbls 10# linear gel. SD.
ISIP 3,582 FG .84. Open well up to fb @ 12:44 p.m. w/3,600 on a 12/64
ck. SDFD. (JD)

SWI @ 12:00 a.m. made 759 bbls in 11 hrs 15 min. TR 5,408, BLWTR
6,883 bbls. RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @ 8,850’
Perf stage 10 Dark Canyon {/8,656-60°, 8,820-25°. POOH. RU to frac.
Break dn perfs w/4,600 @ 6.9 bpm. SD. ISIP 3,200 FG .79. Calculate
holes open 12. XL BHT-1 gel frac well w/84,300# 20/40 white, 91,700#
20/40 SB Excel, 2,558 bbls 20# XI. BHT-1 gel, and flushed w/126 bbls
10# linear gel. SD. ISIP 4,250 FG .91. SWI SDFD. (JD)

RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @8,030° Perf stage-11
Wasatch {/7,848-51°, 7,907-10°, 7,935-38°, 7,979-82°. POOH. RU to frac.
Break dn perfs w/3,870 @ 6 bpm. SD. ISIP 1,900 FG .68. XL BHT-1 gel
frac well w/80,000# 20/40 white, 77,600# 20/40 SB Excel, 2,141 bbls 20#
XL BHT-1 gel, and flushed w/112 bbls. SD. ISIP 2,560 FG .76 Open well
up to tb w/2,500 on a 12/64 ck.

SWI @ 12:00 AM. 1,477 bbls in 18 hrs flow time. TR 6,885 bbls,
BLWTR 10,343 bbls. RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP
@ 6,630°, perf stage-12 Wasatch /6,588-92°, 6,600-04’. POOH. RU to
frac. Break dn perfs w/2,600 @ 6 bpm. SD. ISIP 1,540 FG .67. Calculate
holes open 17. XL BHT-1 gel frac well w/77,200# 20/40 white, 83,500#
SB Excel, 2,081 bbls 18# XL BHT-1gel, and flushed w/93 bbls 10# linear
gel. SD. ISIP 1,900, FG .73. SWI. Will have coil on location to drill plugs
in the a.m. SDFD. (JD)

Fd 2,500 sicp. MIRU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/3 5/8” clear cut mill+2 7/8”
ECTD even wall motor+2 7/8” jarst+disconnect+circ sub. Tag plug #1 @
6,630’ drill up and saw O psi inc. RIH tag plug #2 @ 8,030 drill up and
saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #3 @ 8,850 drill up and saw O psi inc. RIH
tag plug #4 @ 9,030° drill up and saw O psi inc. RIH tag plug # 5 @
10,580” drill up and saw O psi inc. RIH tag plug #6 @ 10,790’ drill up and
saw O psi inc. RIH tag plug #7 @ 11,110” drill up and saw 200 psi inc.
RIH tag plug #8 @ 11,680 drill up and saw O psi inc. tag PBTD @
14,157°. Circ and POOH. Turn well over to FB.

Turn well dn tline to sales w/1,500 on a 10/64 ck.



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-45172
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NA
. . o - 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to N A

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oL WELL [] GASWELL /] OTHER State 21-32B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4304739170

PHONE NUMBER:
(303) 483-0044

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100

- Englewood

<

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
Pariette Bench

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1300 FNL & 1880' FWL

county: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW: 32 98 19E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT ] [ O
(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALtercasing [[] FRACTURE TREAT [] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] cAsING REPAIR [] newconsTRUCTION [] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
[[] cHaNGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [[] oreraTOR cHANGE [C] TuBING REPAIR
[] cHaNGE TUBING [[] PLuG AND ABANDON [] VENTORFLARE
] sUBSEQUENT REPORT [[] CHANGE WELL NAME [] pueBack ] WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Oniy)
|:| CHANGE WELL STATUS [C] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion; '
[[] cOMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE otHer: Leak in Pit
[] converTweLL TYPE [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

On April 24,2008 a leak was discovered in the pit used by the State wells 21-32A, 21-32B, and 22-32A. Immediately after the
leak was discovered the pit was drained and repaired. The process of reclaiming the water began immediately and all of the

water was reclaimed by April 30, 2008.

Chuck Wilso\ '\

TITLE

Drilling Manager

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)

§ \S
SIGNATURE Ql\\\)&\\}% MJ,_\‘ e 7/14/2008
(This space for State use only)
RECEIVED
JUL 16 2008
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING



CONFIDENTIAL

GASCO Production Company

State 21-32B-9«19-

NE NW Section 32-T9S-R19E
Uintah County, Utah
API: 043-047-39170

Completion: Mancos “TIGHT HOLE”

1/30/08 RU Halliburton Wireline and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray/VDL log.
Found TOC inside of surface csg.

2/12/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $19,581 CC $2,106,781

3/17/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $77,666 CC $2,184,447

3/18/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC $31,356 CC $ 2,215,803

3/22/08 RU B&C and pressure tested csg to 11500 psi, ok.

3/23/08 Update Costs: (PME) DC: $20,343 CC: $2,236,146

3/23/08 (Sat.) MIRU Halliburton Wireline to perforate Stage 1 — Mancos. Perf

from 14006 - 08°, 14036 - 38°, 14088 - 90°, 14127 - 30°, 3 spf, 120 deg
phased. (SCE)

3/24/08 (Easter Sun.) MIRU Bronco Oilfield Serv for flowback. (SCE)

3/26/08 RU Halliburton 11:55 AM Found 500psi SICP. Break down Mancos with
9227psi at 5 BPM. Frac Stage 1 with 500 gal of 15% HCL followed by
Slickwater. Well pressured out after pumping 5000# of 30-50 Carbo-
Prop. Left 3100# in Casing 1900# in Formation. Screened-out on 0.25PPG
sand. Bled down to 7467psi after 12 min. Made 57 bbls in 3 hrs. TR 57.
Attempt to pump in again-no good. Put well on flowback with a 10/64
choke with 7100psi. Pressure bled down quickly with minimal flowback.
Made 833 bbls in 9 2 hrs. TR 890. BLWTR .

3/27/08 RU Wireline Did not set a plug #1, due to inability to pump in stage 1.
QECE!VED Tag sand at 13795 Perforate Stage 2 Mancos 13612-14, 13630-32,
13676-78, 13714-16, 13758-60, 13787-90. 3SPF 120 deg phase. Found
AUG 042008 6751 psi SICP. Broke dn perfs @ 9126 @ 4.7 bpm. Pumped 1 }2 gal
GPT throughout w/ recycled water. Frac well at 5-12-16-20-24 BPM.
DIV, OF CiL, GAS & MINING
Page 1 of 7
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4/2/08

4/3/08

4/4/08

4/7/08

4/8/08

4/9/08
4/10/08
4/14/08

Very difficult to frac. Pumped 64,700# of 30-50 Carbo-prop using 4290
bbls of 20 & 25# linear Gell. ATP 10,500psi at 21 BPM. ISIP-7562.
SWI. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 3 — Mancos. Set CBP (#2
position) @ 13580°. Psi tested plug to 1000 over SI. Perforated f/ 13246
- 48, 13344 —46°, 13402 - 04°, 13499 - 502°, 3 spf. RU to frac. Broke
into perfs @ 9639 psi @ 6 bpm then psi climbed to 10000 psi. Increased
rate to 10 bpm and psi out to 11200. Dropped rate to 7 bpm for 18 min,
and pumped liner gel to perfs. Perfs pressured out to 11400 w/ gel on.
Dropped rate to 2 bpm and pressured out several more times. SWI and
moved iron to (3) State 21-32A. Can’t get any more injection into Stage 3
Total bbls pumped 235. Released Halliburton to further evaluate what
needs to be done to frac. (SCE, JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC: $45,784 CC: $ 2,281,930

RU HES coil tbg. RIH w/ 3 5/8 Blade bit+2 7/8 Even wall ECTD
motor+jars. Circulate well bore while RIH w/ 10# Flow pro using MI
Swaco. Holding 6,000 psi back psi w/ MI Swaco super auto ck and bronco
oilfield serv junk catcher. Tag plug #1 @ 13,580’ drill up and saw 0 psi
increase. RIH tag sand fill @ 13,600 wash dn 30’ at a time and pull up
50 to spread out surface arrival. Tag PBTD @ 14,155°. Circulate
production water to replace 10# and POOH. When sand came to surface
MI Swaco plugged off had to go to bronco ck. Continue POOH holding
5,800 psi back psi w/ck. OOH RDMO Halliburton. Open well up to flow
back w/5,600 psi on a 9/64 ck. SDFN. (JD)

FB #’s 4/3/08

5:00 a.m. 6,900 psi, 9/64 ck, made 63 bbls
6:00 a.m. 6,500 ps,i 9/64 ck, made 58 bbls
7:00 a.m. 6,420 psi, 9/64 ck, made 52 bbls
8:00 a.m. 6,400 psi, 9/64 ck, made 60 bbls
9:00 a.m. 6,325 psi, 9/64 ck, made 60 bbls
10:00 a.m. 6,300 psi 9/64 ck, made 49 bbls
11:00 a.m. 6,300 psi 9/64 ck made 51 bbls
TR 1,283 bbls, 0 BLWTR

Bbls water recovered is combined and an average of all three wells. Wells
were ran through a common separator. TR 1,521 bbls, BLWTR 0. Turn
well over to first sales through its own separator. 4/5/08 w/5,215 psi on a
8/64 ck.

Cost update: (PME) DC $246,038 CC $2,527,968
Cost update: (PME) DC $10,787 CC $2,538,755

Perforating Cost update: (PME) DC $35,286 CC $2,574,041
Prep for frac Cost update: (PME) DC $6,244 CC $2,594,836
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4/15/08

4/15/08

4/16/08

4/16/08

4/17/08

4/17/08

4/18/08

4/23/08

4/23/08

4/30/08

5/21/08

MIRU HES wireline Grand Junction. RIH w/2 3%” scalloped guns 3 spf,
and HES 10k CBP. Set HES 10k CBP @ 13,577’. Reperf stage 3
Mancos I1I /13,256-57°, 13,288-89°, 13,322-23°, 13,340-41°, 13,376-77’,
13,410-11°, 13,421-22°, 13,477-48’, 13,484-85’, 13,556-57°, 3 spf 30
holes. POOH. RU HES Frac crew Grand Junction. SDFD. (JD)

Cost update: (PME) DC $ 14,551 CC $2,594,836

Break dn perfs w/10,150 @ 5 bpm. Linear gel frac well 49,000 #’s 30/60
sand, 3,250 bbl’s 20# gel and flushed w/154 bbls. Cut job short due to
well pressure. Job called for 59,000#’s, put 49,000#’s into formation. Had
to cut flush 50 bbls short (screen out). Average psi 9,800, average rate 16
bpm. Open well up to tb @ 9:10 p.m. w/7,500 psi

Cost update: (PME) DC $307,213 CC $2,902,049

4/16/08 1:00 a.m. 7,000 psi Made 198 bbls in 3 hrs 20 min BLWTR 3,208.
RIH w/plug and guns to perf. Set HES 10k CBP @13,210°, psi test to
7,835, 1,000 over sicp. Bleed off to 6,835 psi, test good. Perf stage 4
Mancos IIIT {/12,664-65°, 12,684-85°, 12,742-43’, 12,806-07°, 12,856-
57°, 12,906-07°, 12,956-57’, 13,013-14°, 13,054-55, 13,106-07°, 13,150-
52°’. POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/8,320 @ 5 bpm. Linear gel frac
well w/100,500#’s 30/60 ceramic sand,4,839 bbls 20# linear gel, and
flushed w/180 bbls 10# linear gel. Well treated very tight total pump time
7 hrs. Increase rate and sand conc as formation would allow. Coat last
42,000#’s starting w/1#-1.25# w/sandwedge. Average psi @ tail end of
job 10,500 psi, average rate 22 bpm. SD. ISIP 7,732, FG 1.01 SDFD. (JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC: $7665 CC $2,909,714

RU RIH w/guns. Perf stage Kennilworth/Sunnyside (Perf Only) £/11,778’-
84’,11,784-86°,11,958-62". SWL SDFD. (JD)

RU HES coil tbg. RIH w/3 5/8” drag bit+2 7/8”ECTD even wall motor+2
7/8” jars+circsub+disconnect. Tag HES 10k CBP #1 @ 13,210’ drill up
and saw 1,000 psi increase. RIH tag HES 10k CBP #2 @ 13,577 drill up
and saw 200 psi increase. RIH tag PBTD @ 14,153 circulate and POOH.
RDMO HES coil tbg. Turn well over to fb.

Cost updates: (PME) DC $4656 CC $2,914,370
Cost updates: (PME) DC §$ 229,859 CC $3,144,229

MIRU JW Operating. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @
11,680°. Perf stage-5 Desert/Grassy /11,556-60’, 11,641-44’. POOH.
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5/22/08

5/23/08

5/24/08

5/25/08

5/27/08

5/28/08

5/29/08

RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/5,969 @ 3 bpm. SD. ISIP 4,603 FG .84.
Calculate 9 holes open. Hybrid water frac well w/122,900# 20/40
Optiprop, 1,966 bbls 20# XL. BHT-1 gel, and flushed w/162 bbls 10#
linear gel. SD. ISIP 4,803, FG .84. Open well up to fb @7:15 w/4,600 psi
on a 12/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC $ 216,671 CC $3,360,900

SWI @ 3:00 w/2,650 on a 12/64 ck. Made 626 bbls in 7 hr 45 min, TR
626, BLWTR 1,502. RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP
@ 11,110°. Perf stage-6 Lower Mesaverde /10,942-46°, 11,033-35°,
11,076-79°. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/5,457 @ 3 bpm. SD. ISIP 4,655,
FG .87. Calculate 8 holes open. Hybrid gel frac well w/6,000# 20/40
white, 75,000# 20/40 Optiprop,1,713 bbls 20# XL-BHT 1 gel, and
flushed w/151 bbls 10# linear gel. SD. ISIP 4,658, FG.87. Open well up
to b @ 9:58 w/4,200 on a 12/64 ck to flow bottoms up. SWI @ 4:00 p.m.
w/3,200 on a 12/64 ck. Made 508 bbls in 6 hr’s, TR 1,134 bbls, BLWTR
2,855 bbls. RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @ 10,790°,
Perf stage-7 Lower Mesaverde {/10,660-62°, 10,738-41°, 10,764-68".
POOH. SWI. SDFN. (JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC $155,377 CC $3,516,277

RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/5,237 @ 3.7 bpm. SD. ISIP 4,631, FG .88.
Hybrid gel frac well w/11,300# 20/40 white, 139,000# 20/40
Optiprop,2,765 bbls 20# XL BHT-1 gel, and flushed w/150 bbls 10# linear
gel. SD. ISIP 4,746, FG .89. Open well up to fb 10:30 a.m. w/4,600 on a
12/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

SWI @ 7:00 a.m. w/3,200 on a 12/64 ck. Made 784 bbls in 9 hrs 55 min,
TR 2,174 bbls, BLWTR 4,733 bbls.

7:00 a.m. 4,150 on a 12 ck, TR 1,039, BLWTR 5,517 bbls.

2,500 on a 12/64 ck. Made 2,086 bbls in 48 hrs, TR 3,125 bbls, BLWTR
3,782 bbils. :

SWI @ 3:00 w/2,050 psi on a 12/64 ck. Made 332 bbls in 20 hrs, TR
3,457, BLWTR 3,450.

WSI waiting on sand for frac.
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5/31/08

6/3/08

6/4/08

6/5/08

6/6/08

RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k magnum FTFP @ 10,580°. Perf stage
8 Lower mesaverde 1/10,562-65’, 10,505-08°, 10,420-23, 10,331-34’.
POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perf w/7,215 @ 6 bpm. SD. ISIP 4,641 FG
.89. Calculate holes open 14. Hybrid gel frac well w/15,300# 20/40
white, 188,00# 20/40 Optiprop,3,588 bbls 20# XL BHT-1 gel and
flushed w/142 bbls 10# linear gel. SD. ISIP 4,643 FG .89. SWIL. SDFD.
(JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC $ 226,845 CC $3,743,122

RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @ 9,030°. Perf stage-
9 Dark Canyon 1/8,971-74°, 9,005-08. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/4,900
@ 3.3 bpm. SD. ISIP 3,753 FG .85. Calculate holes open 8. XL BHT-1gel
frac well w/44,300# 20/40 white, 50,600# 20/40 Optiprop, 1,529 bbls
20# XL BHT-1 gel, and flushed w/129 bbls 10# linear gel. SD. ISIP
3,582 FG .84. Open well up to fb @ 12:44 p.m. w/3,600 on a 12/64 ck.
SDFD. (JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC $ 283,817 CC $4,026,939

SWI @ 12:00 a.m. made 759 bbls in 11 hrs 15 min. TR 5,408, BLWTR
6,883 bbls. RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @ 8,850’
Perf stage 10 Dark Canyon {/8,656-60°, 8,820-25°. POOH. RU to frac.
Break dn perfs w/4,600 @ 6.9 bpm. SD. ISIP 3,200 FG .79. Calculate
holes open 12. XL BHT-1 gel frac well w/84,300# 20/40 white, 91,700#
20/40 SB Excel, 2,558 bbls 20# XL BHT-1 gel, and flushed w/126 bbls
10# linear gel. SD. ISIP 4,250 FG .91. SWI SDFD. (JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC $ 114,959 CC $4,141,898

RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP @8,030° Perf stage-11
Wasatch /7,848-51°, 7,907-10°, 7,935-38°, 7,979-82°. POOH. RU to frac.
Break dn perfs w/3,870 @ 6 bpm. SD. ISIP 1,900 FG .68. XL. BHT-1 gel
frac well w/80,000# 20/40 white, 77,600# 20/40 SB Excel, 2,141 bbls
20# XL BHT-1 gel, and flushed w/112 bbls. SD. ISIP 2,560 FG .76
Open well up to fb w/2,500 on a 12/64 ck.

Cost updates: (PME) DC $ 146,836 CC $4,288,734

SWI @ 12:00 AM. 1,477 bbls in 18 hrs flow time. TR 6,885 bbls,
BLWTR 10,343 bbls. RU RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum FTFP
@ 6,630°, perf stage-12 Wasatch {/6,588-92°, 6,600-04’. POOH. RU to
frac. Break dn perfs w/2,600 @ 6 bpm. SD. ISIP 1,540 FG .67. Calculate
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6/11/08

6/12/08

6/25/08

7/7/08

7/21/08

7/24/08

7/28/08

holes open 17. XL BHT-1 gel frac well w/77,200# 20/40 white, 83,500#
SB Excel, 2,081 bbls 18%# XL BHT-1gel, and flushed w/93 bbls 10#
linear gel. SD. ISIP 1,900, FG .73. SWI. Will have coil on location to drill
plugs in the am. SDFD. (JD)

Cost updates: (PME) DC § 79,993 CC $4,368,727

Fd 2,500 sicp. MIRU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/3 5/8” clear cut mill+2 7/8”
ECTD even wall motor+2 7/8” jars + disconnect + circ sub. Tag plug #1
@ 6,630’ drill up and saw O psi inc. RIH tag plug #2 @ 8,030’ drill up and
saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #3 @ 8,850 drill up and saw O psi inc. RIH
tag plug #4 @ 9,030’ drill up and saw O psi inc. RIH tag plug # 5 @
10,580’ drill up and saw O psi inc. RIH tag plug #6 @ 10,790’ drill up and
saw 0 pst inc. RIH tag plug #7 @ 11,110’ drill up and saw 200 psi inc.
RIH tag plug #8 @ 11,680° drill up and saw O psi inc. tag PBTD @
14,157°. Circ and POOH. Turn well over to FB.

Cost updates: (PME) DC $ 117,277 CC $4,486,004

Turn well down sales line w/1,500 on a 10/64 ck. Final fb #s TR 7,388
BLWTR 12,014

Cost updates: (PME) DC $20,526 CC $ 4,506,530

Cost updates: (PME) DC $16,050 CC $ 4,522,580

Cost updates: (PME) DC $16,380 CC $ 4,538,960

Attempted to run BJ Services cap string in hole and was unable to get to

bottom tagged an obstruction @ 10,755’ (SD)
Water Disposal (PME) DC § 2,588 CC $4,541,548

Run production Tbg

7/29/08

7/30/08

7/31/08

M.LS.U. Spot in equipment & R.U. (Rick) DC 2583 CC 4,544,131

MIRU JW Wireline. RIH w/ 8K Magnum kill Plug @ 5230°. PU and
RIH w/ 3 5/8” Chomper bit + POBS + X nipple + 2 3/8” P-105 tbg. Tag
plug and NU power swivel. Loaded hole w/ 65 bbls treated Diklor water.
Drill up plug in 35 min. Tbg and csg went on vacuum. No plug junk to
surface. RIH to 6530°, w/ 206 jts and SDFN. Left well open to pit for
night. (SCE) DC 14683 CC $4,558,814

1300 FCP on 16/64 ck. Unloaded 65 bbls of load wtr. Continue to RIH
w/ tbg. Blew out 2 washington head rubbers while running tbg. SDFN w/
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8/1/08

8/2/08

tbg @ 10565°. Left well flowing for night. (SCE) DC 9150 CC
4,567,964

Cont RIH w/ tbg. Tagged PBTD @ 14171° w/ 450 jts. Pulled up 1 jt,
and pumped off bit in rat hole. POOH and LD 132 jts tbg. Landed tbg @
10003° w/ 317 jts. ND BOP’s. NU wellhead. (SCE) DC 8465 CC
$4,576,429

RDMOL. (SCE) DC 2568 CC $4,578,997
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

AMENDED REPORT [_] FORM 8
(highlight changes)

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-45172

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
N/A

Ta. TYPE OF WELL. OlL GAS
QL oL ory ] OTHER

b. TYPE OF WORK:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME
N/A

8 WELL NAME and NUMBER:

WetL oores e RRTRY REER OTHER State 21-32B-9+5
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 9. APl NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4304739170
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
8 Inverness Drive E, Ste 100 -« Englewood Co 80112 (303) 483-0044 Wildcat

4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES)
ATSURFACE: 1300 FNL & 1880' FWL

AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVAL REPORTED BELOW:  Same

1. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
MERIDIAN:

NENW 32 T9S RJME

9

12. COUNTY 13. STATE

AT TOTAL DEPTH:  Same Uintah UTAH
14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATE T.D. REACHED: 16. DATE COMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GL):

8/19/2007 10/14/2007 4/6/2008 aBaNDONED [ ] READY To PRODUCE /] GL: 4755": KB: 4780.4'
18 TOTALDEPTH:  MD 14248 19 PLUG BACKTD: MD 4157 20, iF MULTIPLE COMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * [21. DEPTHBRIDGE ~ MD

i PLUG SET:
VD 14,248 O 14,157 2 ™o

22 TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23

GR, WP, Cads Cemp2, o, as, mud WAS WELL CORED?

WAS DST RUN?

DIRECTIONAL SURVEY?

no]  ves[]  (submitanalysis)
Nof/]  ves[]  (submitreporty

NO ves []  (submitcopy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#/ft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) STAG%EIS-',\—IENTER CI\IJE(,;AE(;’JSTAYCP)SS& VOEL&I\%ET;BL) CEMENT TOP ** | AMOUNT PULLED
20"
17 1/2" 133/8  H40 484 0 215 G 260 Circ to Surf
12 1/4" 85/8 155 324 0 3.242 G 560 Circ to Surf
G 370
77/8" 4172 PI10 13.54 0 14.200 G 510 Inside Surf
50 poz 2,325
25. TUBING RECORD
SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)
none
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD
FORMATION NAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL (Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS
» Mancos 13,246 14,130 See Attached open [ ] squeezea [ ]
® Mancos 12,664 13,152 WO - N0 open [_] Squeezed | |
© Mesaverde 8,656 11,962 open [ ] squeezed []
™ Wasatch 6.588 7,982 open [ | squeezed [ ]
28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC. p F:'r\ LY 20~
DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNT AND TYPE OF MATER!AL‘,‘ Baahad A 4 C U
See Attached

AUG 18 2008

UV OF OIL, GAS & MININA

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30.WELL STATUS:
[] ELECTRICAUMECHANICAL LOGS [] seorocicreport  [] DSTREPORT  [_] DIRECTIONAL SURVEY Prod ucing
(L] SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION || CORE ANALYSIS [T orrer:

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)



31. INITIAL PRODUCTION

INTERVAL A (As shown In item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION JOIL — BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER -BBL:  |PROD. METHOD
4/6/2008 4/6/2008 24 RATES: = 0 934 300 Flowing
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL — BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER —BBL: HNTERVAL STATUS:
8/64 2,242 RATES:  — A
INTERVAL B (As shown In itemn #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION [OIL — BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER - BBL: |PROD. METHOD
6/12/2008 6/25/2008 24 RATES:  — 0 814 126 Flowing
CHOKE SIZE: |TBG. PRESS. |CSG. PRESS. JAPI GRAVITY §BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO |24 HR PRODUCTION |OIL — BBL: GAS ~ MCF: WATER —BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
12/64 1,976 RATES: - 0 814 126 All Open
INTERVAL C (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL —BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER-BBL:  |PROD. METHOD
RATES: —
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS CSG. PRESS APl GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION JOIL — BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: {INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES. —
INTERVAL D (As shown in item #26)
DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION |OIL —BBL: GAS ~ MCF: WATER - BBL:  }PROD. METHOD:
RATES: —
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS CSG. PRESS. AP GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION JOIL — BBL: GAS — MCF: WATER - BBL: |INTERVAL STATUS:
RATES: —
32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)
Sold
33. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:
Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries
. Top Bottom - Top
Formation (MD) (MD) Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measured Depth)
Wasatch 5,040 8,800
Mesaverde 8,800 12,653
Mancos 12,653 14,248 TD'd well within Mancos

35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS (Include plugging procedure)

36. 1 hereby certify that the

hed inf is

and correct as determined from all avallable records.

Tiree  Petroleum Engineer |

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) MatOwens———
- i

SIGNATURE

DATE

i

LIA0/S

Y

/

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
e completing or plugging a new well

@ drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore

® recompleting to a different producing formation

*ITEM 20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

® reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well

e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth

® drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

**ITEM 24: Cement Top — Show how reported top(s) of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL), cementbond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS)).

Send to:

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Box 145801

Sait Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

(5/2000)

Phone: 801-538-5340

Fax:

801-359-3940
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,-' ’ STATE OF UTAH CONF'UEN.]”AEORMQ

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-45172
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N LOTIEEORTRBEAE
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 7'Nlj:‘7 or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
oitwelL [J  GASWELL OTHER State 21-328
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4304739170

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

8 Invemess Dr E, Ste 100 .. Englewood sy GO, 80112 (303) 483-0044 Pariette Bench

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTaces AT surFace:  1300' FNL & 1880' FWL county: Uintah
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 32 9S8  19E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ acioize [] beepen [ RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

[¥/] Notice oF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ] autercasing ] rracture TREAT [] sipeTRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANDON

] cHaNGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] orerator cHange [J Tueine Rerar
[ craneeTuBING [[] PLUG AND ABANDON [ venTorFLare

[0 sussequeNT REPORT [ cHance weLt nave [ rueeack [ wareroisposaL

(Submit Origlnal Form Only)
[ cHanee weLL sTATUS [] PRODUCTION (STARTRESUME) [ warer sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:

[[] comminGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ ] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE ] omier: Site Security
[ converTweLLTYPE [0 RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see attached a copy of the site security diagram for this well.

Production Clerk

Jessica Beyg TILE

NAME (PLEASE PRI

12/15/2008

SIGNATURE DATE

{This space for s@ only) b '[_he u
Accepted by :
Utah Division of - RECEIVED

Oil, Gas and Mining * DEC 16 2008

HN

(5/2000) F Or ReCOI'd Onléée Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV. CF OIL, GAS & MINING



A

To Field Line

400 bbl 400 bbl
(12' x 20") (12' x 20")

s
[1v]

O AN
201
(]

400 bbl
(12' x 20')

Z
[}

—
=

500 gal
methanol
1es 00€

— Meter

T

9 bbl (30" x 10')

= . .
POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING PRODUCTION r-————-- - -——- = — — — A - -‘-\i/— H onzo ntal Se pa ra‘to

VALVES LINE PURPOSE POSITION ~ SEAL INSTALLED

D Drain Closed Yes

F Qil, Gas, Water Open No

O Overflow Open/Closed No 8 5

Vo Vent Open No g S -

R Recycle Closed Yes ) [«}]

H Heat Open No — G) E

s Sales Closed Yes = I

POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING SALES ) —I;\ 1

VALVES LINE PURPOSE POSITION  SEALINSTALLED (F ] ] '

S LNE PURROSE FOSTION ¢ F 9 bbl (30" x 10")

F QOil, Gas, Water  Closed Yes Fan .

O Owdow  Cemd Y L _(F)| Horizontal Separato

\% Vent Open No A

R Recycle Closed Yes

H  Heat Closed No

S Sales Open No

|
|
|
|
1
|
|
|
POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING WATER DRAIN I
|
|
|
|
|
|
l
|
|

|
|
w t .
VALI;/ES g,l:iPURPOSE cF‘)OSrI]TION flEALINSTALLED I % 8 %
£ Gl Sm : =40 l;l =
PoE wm W | ‘&— 9bbl (30" x 10)
| e m e mm e —— {rF»] Horizontal Separato
| |
l I 'Fencel
| —
‘Well _________ [l 1
Head | | 1
22-32B o * W .
b 1
______________ : |
o Q
21-32B :
| . + } + } +
A “““““““““ ’ BUYS & ASSOCIATES, INC.
21-32A ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULTANTS
LEGEND Gasco Production Company
" Flow vaie. Note: This Site State #21-32A & B and State #22-32B
0 - Overflow Security Plan is on ae - and clate 3

v vent file at the Gasco NE/NW Sec. 32 T9S R19E (SURFACE)
N o Field Office. Uintah County, Utah

S - Sales Valve October 2008

Not to Scale




API Well No: 43047391700000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-45172

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
STATE 21-32B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047391700000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

1300 FNL 1880 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
!/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [} cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] cHANGE TuBING [} cHANGE WELL NAME
1/1/2011
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ peepen [J FRACTURE TREAT [] NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE !/ WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [0 waTER sHuTOFF [0 s1TA sTATUS EXTENSION [0 app ExTENsION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south

to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of
water from this well.

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in addition

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

pate:__ 01/05/2011

By: L.

)

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31, 2010




API Well No: 43047391700000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING As7s :
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6- IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current -
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
DRILL form for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well STATE 21-32B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047391700000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext PARIETTE BENCH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1300 FNL 1880 FWL

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
!/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [} cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] cHANGE TuBING [} cHANGE WELL NAME
1/19/2011
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ peepen [J FRACTURE TREAT [] NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [0 waTER sHuTOFF [0 s1TA sTATUS EXTENSION [0 app ExTENsION
Report Date:
[] WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION ' oTHER OTHER: | wellbore sterilization

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Gasco intends to sterilize this wellbore with a Chlorine Dioxide chemical to
combat H2S and ensure the transportation of gas. While pulling the Capillary Approved by the
string out of the hole in preparation for the sterilization procedure, it became Utah Division of
lodged and needs to be fished out of the hole. Approximately 3,800’ of Oil, Gas and Mining
capillary string was left in the hole to be fished. Once both the cap string and
tubing are out of the hole, Gasco plans on proceeding with the sterilizationphte: {""\01,/24/291\1

the wellbore, re-landing tubing and running a new cap string. { )Q/\ [L ‘;iuvj
By: oS ; .
NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor
SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 1/19/2011

RECEIVED January 19, 2011




API Well No: 43047391700000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
ML-45172

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
STATE 21-32B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047391700000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
1300 FNL 1880 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
D NOTICE OF INTENT D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS D CHANGE TUBING D CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT D NEW CONSTRUCTION
3/ 1/20 1 1 D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION D APD EXTENSION
[] WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION ' oTHER OTHER: | Wellbore Sterilization

Gasco fished approximately 3,800' of capillary string out of the hole,

dioxide, and returned the well to production.

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

additionally tubing was removed. Gasco sterilized the wellbore with chlorindccepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 3/14/2011




Sundry Nunber: 50343 APl Well Nunber: 43047391700000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING L AE 172 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well STATE 21-32B
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047391700000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
1300 FNL 1880 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
1/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT / NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Gasco Production Company replaced a 400 bbl water tank on this Accepted by the

location. Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
April 24, 2014

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Lindsey J. Cooke 303 996-1834 Production Tech
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 4/24/2014

RECEI VED: Apr. 24, 2014




Division of Qil, Gas and Mining

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:

Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265

7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500

Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237

303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV
WELL INFORMATION:

Well Name Sec [TWN [RNG [API Entity Mineral |Surface |[Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:

1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:

1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A

3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015

4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016

5. UICS on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A

6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None

7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A
NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:

1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUR0027842

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A

3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUR0027845

DATA ENTRY:

1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on:

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on:

3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on:

4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on:

5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on:
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on:

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

SUR0035619 -FCB

1/22/2016
1/22/2016
1/22/2016
N/A
1/22/2016
N/A

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016

COMMENTS:

1/22/2016



From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

Well Name Section |TWN |RNG |API Number |Entity |Mineral |Surface |Type |Status
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S | 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S |190E |4304752522 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304752538 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S |190E |4304752544 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304752545 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304752546 Federal |Federal OW |APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753026 Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 421-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753027 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753029 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 431-29-9-19 29 090S |190E [4304753030 | Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753031 | Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 414-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753070 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753073 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753076 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304753078 Federal |Federal (GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S | 190E 4304753079 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753080 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753133 Federal |Federal GW |APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754479 State State |GW_|APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754480 State State |GW |APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754481 State State |GW_|APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754482 State State |GW |APD
State 323-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754483 State State |GW |APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754529 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304754541 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754542 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754543 State State |GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304753012 |19650 Federal |Federal | GW |DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301333098 (15941 |Federal |Federal (GW |OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S |190E 4304736915 {16556 |Fee Fee GW _|OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738573 17201 |Federal Federal |(GW |OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304739777 |18344 |[Federal Federal GW |OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S |190E 4304739800 [17202 |Federal Federal GW |OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S |150E 4301332391 13787 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S |170E 4301332447 114033 |State State |GW_|P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S |150E 4301332475 |14417 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S |170E 4301332560 [14726 |Federal |Federal | GW |P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S |160E 4301332611 14439 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 124-11-17 4 110S |170E|4301332674 |15537 |Federal |Federal GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S |170E|4301332676 |15242 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332679 14033 |[Federal |Federal  GW |P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S |150E 4301332685 [16082 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S |170E 4301332730 |15243 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332773 |15370 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 110S [170E 4301332778 14802 Federal |Federal | GW [P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 1110S |160E 4301332888 15098 |State State |GW P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S [170E|4301333081 |15714 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S |170E 4301333087 ;15807 [Federal |Federal \GW |P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S [170E|4301333099 ;15920 Federal |[Federal GW [P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S |140E 4301333437 |16919 Federal |Federal | GW |P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 i 24 110S !140E 4301333443 /16367 Federal [Federal GW |P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S |180E 4304730129 16266 |State State |OW [P
RBU 5-11D 11 100S |180E 4304730409 9005 |Federal Federal OW P |
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S | 180E 4304730624 (9030 |Federal |Federal |OW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 6-2D 2 100S [180E 4304731190 |7075 |State |State |OW |P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S |190E 4304731200 |6155 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S |180E 4304731280 |16267 |State  |State |OW |P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731352 |16268 [Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731357 |7053 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 8-10D 10 100S |180E 4304731364 (4955 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731539 |9965 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S [180E 4304731651 |10688 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 2-10D 10 100S |180E[4304731801 {10784 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S |180E [4304733600 |13213 [Federal |Federal  OW |P
RBU 3-12D 12 100S |180E [4304733739 |14492 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733741 14244 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S |190E|4304733750 |13174 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S |180E 4304733983 |13182 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S |[190E|4304734111 113441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304734168 |14150 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S | 190E 4304734169 |14140 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304734199 |13601 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304734201 |13641 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304734202 |13455 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S |170E [4304734286 |13492 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S |190E[4304734314 |14440 State  |State |GW |P
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 100S | 180E 4304734539 13491 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S |170E |4304734551 |13726 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S |190E 4304734607 113640 Federal |Federal |GW [P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 14304734608 [14151 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S |180E 4304734924 [14280 [Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304735343 14202 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735404 [14203 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S |190E[4304735405 {14928 |Federal |Federal GW |P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S |190E[4304735588 |14418 |State | Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304735606 |14441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304735614 |14442 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S |190E (4304735623 114640 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304735624 14419 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735732 14496 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S |190E|4304735733 14519 |Fee Fee |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S |180E 4304735808 |15592 |[Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 100S |190E 4304735844 14356 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304735845 |14639 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S |190E|4304735995 |14871 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304736093 |14976 |Federal |Federal |(GW |P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S |190E[4304736094 [16120 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736095 |14872 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304736113 |15096 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736219 |14738 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736220 (14763 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736233 |14764 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304736241 |14992 [State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S |180E (4304736242 |14716 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S |190E|4304736271 15884 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736336 |15086 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736368 |15605 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736442 |15715 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736600 14977 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304736719 |15186 Federal Federal | GW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 125 090S |180E 4304736727 !15475 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736739 |15476 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736740 |15213 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S |190E|4304736771 |15355 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S | 180E 4304736772 |15338 [Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S ' 190E (4304736817 15212 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S |190F 4304736913 |15187 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S |190E 4304736916 (17012 |Fee Fee |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304737115 |15011 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S |190E (4304737116 |16163 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190F 4304737117 |16275 |Federal [Federal |GW [P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180F 4304737132 |15087 |State  |State |GW [P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737338 15365 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304737611 [16311 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304737612 16051 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737613 (16052 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S (190E 4304737621 |16253 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S |190F [4304737622 |16264 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737630 |16557 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737631 15961 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737646 16023 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S '180F |4304737647 16121 |Federal [Federal GW |P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304737676 16254 State  |State |GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737677 |15806 |State  |State |GW |P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304738028 |16868 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738336 (16467 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304738337 16119 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738351 |16884 |Federal [Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738352 |16349 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S |180F 4304738353 16210 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738407 16236 |Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S |180F 4304738465 16558 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738469 |16449 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S |190E |4304738575 |16312 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S | 190F |4304738673 115832 |Fee Fee |GW [P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S |180E 4304738896 16792 Federal |Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S |190E 4304739170 |16309 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S '190E 4304739171 /16308 [State  |State |GW |P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S '190F [4304739172 [16310 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304739717 |17054 Federal |[Federal |GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739729 |17241 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739730 (17266 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S |180E |4304739773 (17013 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S |190E 4304740233 |17014 |[Federal Federal |GW [P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S |190E 14304751280 |18211 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304751281 |18210 |[Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190 4304752870 {19647 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304752872 |19648 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 ] 30 090S |190E 4304753011 |19649 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S |180F (4304753324 [19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753325 |19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S |180F |4304753326 19747 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304753327 |19747 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753328 '19783 [State  |State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S '170E[4301332677 |15144 |State  |State |GW S
RBU 4-11D 11 100S |180E 14304730718 |16269 |Federal |Federal (OW [S




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-11D 11 100S |180E |4304730826 116270 |[Federal |Federal OW |S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731192 16271 |Federal |Federal OW |S
STATE 2-32B 32 090S |190E 4304732221 |11371 State  |State |GW_|S
STATE 9-36A 36 090S |180E |4304732225 |11364 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S |190E 4304733581 |13249 |Federal |Federal |GW |S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733598 17838 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 16-26A - 26 090S |180E 4304733601 |12928 |Federal 'Federal | GW |S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S |190E 4304733653 13077 |[Federal Federal (GW |S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S |180E|4304734312 [16265 |[Federal |Federal OW 'S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304739776 (17149 Federal |Federal GW |S




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-76482

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

®. IFINDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WEL
Y owwew [J

GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT-
7979 E. Tufts Ave. crry Denver s1are CO 580237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTAGES AT sURFAce: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL county: Uintah

QTR/AQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 108 18E S STATE: y

TAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ TYPE OF ACTION
[ aciize [J oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

2] nNoTiCE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [ Arercasing

Approximate date work will start [[] casingrepar

4/16/2015

[] crance TueinG

[] suBseQUENTREPORT  |[T] cHaNce weLL NAME

(Submit Originat Form Only)

Date of work completion:

[C] converT weLL Type

[ cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS

[] cHance weLL sTaTUS
[C] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

[[] eracture TrReAT

[C] ~ewconsTRucTION

[/] oPeraTOR CHaNGE

[ Puucanp ABanDON

[ ruseack

[] ProDUCTION (STARTRESUME)

[J RecLAMATION OF WELL SITE

[C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] sibETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
[J TeEmPORARILY ABANDON
] rtueinc Repair

[J venrorFLare

[ warter bisposaL

] waTER sHuT-OFF

1 omer:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11
Denver CO 80237

303-996-1805 M i

Michael Decker, Exec. Vice President & COO

Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite,115
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805 -

Michael Decker, Exec. Vicd President & COO

RECEIVED
JUN 02 2015

DIV, QF OIL, GAS & MINING

APPROVED

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) LjLndsey C°°ks rme Engineering Tech
SIGNATURE ‘ ( ﬁl@/ oate 9/18/2015
(This space for State use only)
JAN 2 2 2016
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

| V. OlL GAS & MINING -
BYWM\&



Well Name

FEDERAL 332-30-9-19

WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19

FEDERAL 12-17-9-19

GATE CYN 31-21-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16

WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08

GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17
RYE PATCH FED 22-21

RYE PATCH FED 24-21

RBU 5-11D

FEDERAL 7-25A

RBU 6-2D

NGC 33-18)

RBU 13-2D

RBU 16-3D

RBU 10-11D

RBU 8-10D

RBU 15-3D

RBU 12-12D

RBU 2-10D

RBU 3-15D

RBU 3-12D

STATE 7-36A

FEDERAL 34-29
FEDERAL 24-7 #1

FEDERAL 23-29 #1

FED 24-20-9-19

FED 44-20-9-19

FED 23-21-9-19

FED 32-31-9-19

FED 42-29-9-19

PETES WASH 23-12 #1

STATE 4-32B

FED 14-18-2 #1

FED 43-24-3 #1

LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19

FED 11-21-9-19

FED 22-30-10-18

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

FED 11-22-9-19

FED 42-21-9-19

STATE 24-16-9-19

Section TWN
30 090S
29 1008
23 0908
26 0908
19 090S
17 090S
21 1108
32 1008
20 1108
17 1008
19 1108
32 1008
4 1108
32 1008
29 1008
16 1108
16 1008
29 1008
8 1108
16 1108
20 1008
20 1008
4 1108
22 1108
24 1108
11 1008
25 0908
2 1008
18 090S
2 1008
3 1008
11 1008
10 100S
3 1008
12 100S
10 1008
15 1008
12 1008
36 090S
29 0908
7 1008
29 090S
20 090S
20 090S
21 090S
31 090S
29 090S
12 1008
32 090S
18 1008
24 1008
22 0908
21 0908
30 1008
30 090S
22 090S
21 090S
16 090s

RNG
190E
170E
190E
180E
190E
190E
1S0E
170E
150E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
170E
150E
170E
170E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
140E
140E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
170E
190E
180E
170E
190E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E

API

4304753012
4301333098
4304736915
4304738573
4304739777
4304739800
4301332391
4301332447
4301332475
4301332560
4301332611
4301332619
4301332674
4301332676
4301332679
4301332685
4301332730
4301332773
4301332778
4301332888
4301333081
4301333087
4301333099
4301333437
4301333443
4304730409
4304730624
4304731190
4304731200
4304731280
4304731352
4304731357
4304731364
4304731539
4304731651
4304731801
4304733600
4304733739
4304733741
4304733750
4304733983
4304734111
4304734168
4304734169
4304734199
4304734201
4304734202
4304734286
4304734314
4304734539
4304734551
4304734607
4304734608
4304734924
4304735343
4304735404
4304735405
4304735588

Entity
19650
15941
16556
17201
18344
17202
13787
14033
14417
14726
14439
15649
15537
15242
14033
16082
15243
15370
14802
15098
15714
15807
15920
16919
16367
9005

9030

7075

6155

16267
16268
7053

4955

9965

10688
10784
13213
14492
14244
13174
13182
13441
14150
14140
13601
13641
13455
13492
14440
13491
13726
13640
14151
14280
14202
14203
14928
14418

Mineral
Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Surface Type

Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW

Status

335532
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FEDERAL 31-21-9-19
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19

LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19

DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18
STATE 12-32-9-19

FEDERAL 12-20-9-19
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19

DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18

SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19

21
29
31
31
22
14
22

36
32
20
20
30
26
36
36
36
36
36
31
31
31
31
25
19
25
30
25
19
25
30
22
14
36

1008
1008
090S
090S

090S
090S
0908
1008
100S

100S
100S
100S

0908

090S
090S

090S
090S
090S

190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
190E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
180E
190E

4304735606
4304735614
4304735623
4304735624
4304735732
4304735733
4304735808
4304735844
4304735845
4304735995
4304736093
4304736094
4304736095
4304736113
4304736219
4304736220
4304736233
4304736241
4304736242
4304736271
4304736336
4304736368
4304736442
4304736600
4304736719
4304736727
4304736739
4304736740
4304736771
4304736772
4304736817
4304736913
4304736916
4304737115
4304737116
4304737117
4304737132
4304737338
4304737611
4304737612
4304737613
4304737621
4304737622
4304737630
4304737631
4304737646
4304737647
4304737676
4304737677
4304738028
4304738336
4304738337
4304738351
4304738352
4304738353
4304738407
4304738465
4304738469
4304738575

14441
14442
14640
14419
14496
14519
15592
14356
14639
14871
14976
16120
14872
15096
14738
14763
14764
14992
14716
15884
15086
15605
15715
14977
15186
15475
15476
15213
15355
15338
15212
15187
17012
15011
16163
16275
15087
15365
16311
16051
16052
16253
16264
16557
15961
16023
16121
16254
15806
16868
16467
16119
16884
16349
16210
16236
16558
16449
16312

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
State
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
State
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
Gw
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
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LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18
STATE 21-32B

STATE 22-32A

STATE 21-32A

FEDERAL 11-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID)
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19

Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18

22
11
32
32
32
19
25
25
I

19
30
19
30
30
30
36
36
36
36

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36

WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17
SQUAW CROSSING U §
RBU 4-11D

RBU 2-11D

RBU 6-11D

STATE 2-32B

STATE 9-36A
FEDERAL 13-30B
STATE 13-36A
FEDERAL 16-26A
FEDERAL 31-29

RBU 1-10D

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19

32
2

11
11
11
32
36
30
36
26
29
10
18

090S
100S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
100S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
0908
090S
100S
1008
100S
1008
1008
090S
0908
0908
090S
0908
090S
100S
090S

190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
170E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E

4304738673
4304738896
4304739170
4304739171
4304739172
4304739717
4304739729
4304739730
4304739773
4304740233
4304751280
4304751281
4304752870
4304752872
4304753011
4304753324
4304753325
4304753326
4304753327
4304753328
4301332677
4304730129
4304730718
4304730826
4304731192
4304732221
4304732225
4304733581
4304733598
4304733601
4304733653
4304734312
4304739776

15832
16792
16309
16308
16310
17054
17241
17266
17013
17014
18211
18210
19647
10648
19649
19783
19783
19747
19747
19783
15144
16266
16269
16270
16271
11371
11364
13249
17838
12928
13077
16265
17149

Fee
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
State
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

Fee
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
State
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
ow
ow
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
ow
ow
ow
ow
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
ow
GW
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