UNITED STATES GOVERNMENT

MEMORANDUM

DATE: January 24, 2007
REPLY TO o ’
ATTN OF:  Acting Superintendent, Uintah & Ouray Agency {564 3599

SUBJECT: APD Concurrence for Questar Exploration & Production Company

TO: Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office
Attn: Minerals & Mining Division

We recommend the approval of the Application for Permit to Drill (APD) for the listed WELL SITES
with required stipulations:

ROW No. Well Name/No. Modification Type
H62-2001-304 GB 10W-30-8-22 & GB 10SG-30-8-22 Well Site GB 10SG-30-8-22 added to easement
H62-2002-120 OUGB 12WX-29-8-22 & GB 125G-29-8-22 Well Site GB 12SG-29-8-22 added to easement
H62-2003-115 GB TMU-36-8-21 & GB 78G-36-8-21 Well Site GB 7SG-36-8-21 added to easement
H62-2003-123 GB 4MU-36-8-21 & GB 45G-36-8-21 Well Site GB 45G-36-8-21 added to easement
H62-2004-423 FR 7P-36-14-19 & FR 9P-36-14-19 Well Site FR 7P-36-14-19 added to easement

Based on the available information received at the site specific onsite inspections the proposed locations were
cleared in the following areas of environmental impact.

YES NO | X Listed threatened endangered species

YES NO | X Critical wildlife habitat

YES NO | X Archaeological or cultural resources

YES NO Air quality aspects (to be used only if Project is in or adjacent to a Class I area

Enclosed is a copy of the BIA’s Environmental Analysis (EA) concurred and signed by the Ute Indian

Tribe. Please refer to item 6.0 for Mitigation Stipulations as well as any applicable stipulations in 10.0
for Additional Stipulations

REMARKS: The Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals (E&M) Department also requires that all companies adhere to
the following criteria, during and after, all phases of construction activities.

DL e



@ ®
5-5443 ’

UNITED STATES
o _ DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
e BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS -

ADMINISTRATIVE

MODIFICATION
ALLOTMENT NO.: - CONTRACT NO.
ROW NO.: H62-2004-423 T.B.
) PAGE

It is hereby agreed by and between the Superintendent for the Bureau of Indian Affairs,
lessor(s), and Questar Exploration & Production Company, lessee, that GRANT OF RIGHT
OF WAY EASEMENT No. H62-2004-423 be modified to provide the following:

1. CHANGE WELL NAME TO READ:

T T " FR 7P-36-14-19 & FR 9P-36-14-19,
) vice the originally granted FR 8P-36-14-19, FR 9P-36-14-19 & FR 16P-36-14-19

RECORDED NO:

" This modification does not change any of the terms, conditions, or stipulations except as specifically set forth herein.

(AnkAdministrati've Modification does not require the signature or approval of the Lessee)

N/A N/A
(Additional Lessee’s of Record, if applicable) (Lessee)

N/A N/A
(Lessor) (Lessor)

UNITED STATES INDIAN SERVICE

-

The within the modification is hereby approved and declared to be made in accordance with the

law and the rules and regulations prescnbed by the Secretary of the Interior thereunder, and now
in force.

Pursuant to authority delegated to the Assistant -Secretary — Indian Affairs by 209 DM 8, 230
DM 1, and to the Western Regional Director by 3 IAM 4 (Release No. 99-03), and to the
‘Superinténdent/Field Representatives by 10 BIAM 14, as amended by Western Regional Release

No. 97-1 an any further delegation needed to effectuate the reorganlzatlon embodied in DM-
Releases dated April, 2003.

DATE APPROVED: January 24. 2007 SQ)& oy

Acting Superintendent
Uintah and Ouray Agency
Fort Duchesne, Utah

S SUPERINTENDENT’S ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

Subscribed and swom to by Dmah M. Peltier, before me, a Notary Public in and for the
County of U1ntah State of Utah thlS 24™ day of J January, 2007.

M) G et

1__ oo P s C B} Sarah A. Jack, Notary Phblic
:_: yComm1ssmn Expires: June 16, 2010

v 9"‘L blit
t AL JACK

2., R0 Box 130
2 UT 840260

on Expires

2010
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. testar Exploration and Production Company
a”EST%R ) 11002 East 17500 South
| Vernal, UT 84078

Tel 435 781 4300 - Fax 435 781 4329

January 23, 2007

Ms. Diana Whitney

State of Utah

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, Ut 84114-5801

Re:  Directional Drilling R649-3-11
FR 7P-36-14-19
SURFACE: 1910’ FSL 162’ FWL, NWSW, LOT 3 SECTION 31, T14S, R20E
BOTTOM HOLE: 1800’ FNL 1800’ FEL, SWNE, SECTION 36, T14S, R19E

Dear Ms. Whitney:

Pursuant to the filing of FR 7P-36-14-19 Application for Permit to Drill regarding the
above referenced well on January 23, 2007 we are hereby submitting this letter in
accordance with Oil & Gas Conservation Rule R649-3-11 pertaining to the location and
drilling of a directional well.

FR 7P-36-14-19 is located in T14S, R19E, Section 36 in the SWNE.

Questar Exploration & Production, Co. 1571 East 1700 South, Vernal, Utah 84078, is
permitting this well as a directional well due to topographic reasons. Locating the well at
the surface location and directionally drilling from this location. Questar will be able to
utilize the existing roads and pipelines in the area.

Furthermore, surface is owned by the Ute Tribe and QEP has been granted a ROW for
the surface location.

There are no other lease owners within 460’ of all points along the intended directional
wellbore as shown on the attached plat. Therefore, based on the above stated
information, Questar Exploration & Production, Co. requests the permit be granted
pursuant to R649-3-11.

espectfully,

‘&/3/)\, JAN 2 5 y007

Jan Nelson
Regulatory Affairs
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES FORM 3
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING
5. MINERAL LEASE NO:  |6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL ML-49279 TRIBAL
1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILLLA 0 REENTER [ peePEN 7. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
UTE TRIBE
B.TYPEOFWELL  [Jom GAS OTHER SINGLE ZONE [ MULTIPLE ZONE 8. UNIT Or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO. FR 7P-36-14-19 japif)
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: M
1571 E. 1700 S. CITY VERNAL STATE UT zir 84078 (435) 781-4032 UNSESISNATED F‘ 01}"(‘20(1!(/

4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES)

11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

AT SURFACE: 1910 FSL 162' FWL NWSW, LOT 3, SECTION 31, T14S, R20E MERIDIAN:
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: 1800’ FNL 1800' FEL SWNE,SEC. 36, T14S, R19E NWSW 31 14S 20E
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
53.4 +/- MILES SOUTHWEST OF OURAY, UTAH UINTAH UTAH

15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
162 +/ - 594.49 40
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 18. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET) 12,100 TVD 965003033
12,462' MD
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR,ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:
7443.4' GR ASAP 50 DAYS
24 “PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE; QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
17 172 13 3/8 H-40 48 500 SEE ATTACHED DRILLING PROGRAM
12 174 9 5/8 J-55 40 4400 SEE ATTACHED CEMENT CALCULATIONS
8 1/2 5 1/2 P-110 17 D
25 ATTACHMENTS
VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERATION GENERAL RULES:
WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PLAN
EVIDNECE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER O Form 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE QOWNI
pa)
NAME (PLEASE PHINT) J4N Nelson TITLE  Regulatpry Affairs ‘

SIGNATURE )5/~ ‘/ M&)\: DATE _1/23/0

¥ A v 3
(This space for Sfatf use onlyf m

/ n ’
API NUMBER ASSIGNED: 4 3-04-3794 2 APPROVAL:




Set Morked

T14S, R20E, S.L.B.&M.

SB9'54'W — 5181.00" (G.L.0.)

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PROD. »

Well location, FR #7P-36—14—19, located as shown
in LOT 3 of Section 31, T14S, R20E, S.L.B.&M.
Uintah County, Utah.

BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK (59 WF) LOCATED IN THE NW 1/4 OF SECTION 10,
T15S, R20E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE FLAT ROCK MESA
QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID .
ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 7449 FEET. .

Stone *
RI|R
19120
E|E
LOT 1
™
8
N
E NOTE: ~
. THE PROPOSED BOTTOM HOLE FOR THIS WeLL IS | O
& LOCATED IN THE SW 1/4 NE 1/4 OF SECTION 36, §-J
&) LOT 2 T14S, RIGE, S.LB.&M. AT A DISTANCE OF 1800 | &
0 ' FNL 1800° FEL. IT BEARS N51'28'26"W 2516.10° |
| FROM THE PROPOSED WELL HEAD. ' )
: g
8 37 X
g )
2| R #7P-36-14-19 , -
Elev. Ungraded Ground = 7444’ 2
162'—-]: - o
z
LOT 3
©
>
LOT 4
get Morked
tone 1.0°
. S ked
gleg;::/'ngn;ree‘ -—] T 1 4S Sforn’:a’ ° A
S89°29'27"W ~ 5221.68' (Meos.) T15S
(AUTONOMOUS NAD 83)
LEGEND: LATITUDE = 39°33'13.83" (39.553842)
L_ . LONGITUDE = 109°43'46.04" (109.7294586)
= 90" SYMBOL (AUTONOMOUS NAD 27)
@ = PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE = 39°33'13.96" (39.553878)

LONGITUDE = 109°43'43.55" (109.728764)

BASIS OF BEARINGS : .ﬁ
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. o

[~} . o

Q = =]

= -8 © 4 2
SCALE

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT @NB

FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SN
SUPERVISION AND THAT SHGFFA
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDCESAM

Revised: 1-23-07

Uintan ENGINEERING & LaND SurvEYING
85 SOUTH 200 EAST -~ VERNAL, UTAH 84078
(435) 789-1017
SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:
1" = 1000’ 1-18-07 1-19-07
PARTY i REFERENCES
B.H. C.G. K.G. G.L.O. PLAT
WEATHER ) FLE  QUESTAR EXPLORATION
WARM & PROD.

A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED.
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FR 7P-36-14-19

Surface: 1910’ FSL, 162’ FWL, Sec. 31, T14S-R20E
BHL: 1800’ FNL, 1800’ FEL, Sec. 36, T14S—-R19E

05722\Maps\Utah maps\FR 7p-3g-14-19.cdr




Additional Operator Remarks

Questar Explor. & Prod. Co. proposes to directional drill a well to 12,100' TVD to test the
Pre-Cambrian. If productive, casing will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well will be
plugged and abandoned as per BLM and State of Utah requirements"

See Onshore Order No. 1 attached

Please be advised that Questar Explor. & Prod. Co. agrees to be responsible under the terms
and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No.965003033. The principal is Questar
Explor. & Prod. Co. via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR 3104.2.



~ ONSHORE OIL & GA’RDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
FR 7P-36-14-19

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation TVD MD Prod. Phase Anticipated
Green River Sfc Sfc

Wasatch 2410 2469

Mesa Verde 4365 4514 Gas
Castle Gate 6235 6470

Mancos 6925 7191

Dakota Silt 10,265 10,822

Dakota 10,360 10,722’ Gas
Cedar Mountain 10,440 10,997

Morrison 10,650 11,012

Curtis 11,205 11,567

Entrada 11,285 11,647’ Gas
Carmel 11,610 11,972

Wingate 11,820 12,182 Gas
D 12,100 12,462

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas.
Or other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation TVD Depth MD Depth
0Oil/Gas Mesa Verde 4,365’ 4,514.0°
Oil/Gas Dakota 10,360’ 10,722.0°
O1l/Gas Entrada 11,285’ 11,647.0°
O1l/Gas Wingate 11,820’ 12,182.0°
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 onsHORE oiL & caSRDER NO. 1 @

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
FR 7P-36-14-19

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If no flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted.

Fresh water will be obtained from Willow Creek water right #49-2183 / Permit# T75500.

All waste water resulting from drilling operations will be disposed of at RNI disposal pit
located in NWNE Section 5, T9S, R22E.

3. Operator’s Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:
A. 5,000 psi W.P. Double Gate BOP or Single Gate BOP (schematic attached)
B. Functional test daily
C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2 psi/foot or 1500 psi, or 70 % of
burst whichever is greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure
shall not exceed the internal yield pressure of the casing.
D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 5M system and individual components shall
be operable as designed.
4. Casing Program

Depth Hole Size Csg Size Type Weight
Surface 500° 17 %> 13 3/8” H-40 481b/ft (new)
Intermediate 4400’ 12 ¥ 95/8” J-55 401b/ft (new)
Production TD 8 1” 5% P-110 171b/ft(new)



- ONSHORE OIL & GA!(DER NO. 1 ‘

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
FR 7P-36-14-19

5.

Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock — yes

B. Float at the bit — no
C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system — visually
D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor — yes

E. Rotating Head — yes
If drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6” in diameter and extend at least 100’ from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit. :

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling

below 500”).
H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.
I A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the

blooie lines for dust suppression.

Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will
be used. It is not intended to use oil in the mud, however, in the event it is used, oil
concentration will be less than 4% by volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 9.5
ppg-

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.
PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.
Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores — none anticipated

B. DST — none anticipated
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' ONSHORE OIL & GAS.{DER NO. 1 .
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
FR 7P-36-14-19

Logging — Mud logging — 4500 to TD
GR-SP-Induction
Neutron Density
FMI

C. Formation and Completion Interval: Wingate interval, final
determination of completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation — Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

Cementing Program

See attached Cementing Recommendation.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and

across zones as required by the authorized officer to insure protection of natural
resources.

Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 5522 psi. Maximum
anticipated bottom hole temperature is 208° F.

Surface Owner
The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by the Ute Tribe.
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Weatherford

Drilling Services

Proposal

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION
FR #7P-36-14-19

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

WELL FILE:PLAN 1

JANUARY 23, 2007

Weatherford International, Ltd.
15710 John F. Kennedy Blvd, Suite 700
Houston, Texas 77032 USA
+1.281.260.1300 Main
+1.281.260.4730 Fax
www.weatherford.com



QUESTAR

True Vertical Depth [2000ft/in]

FR #7P-36-14-19

1910'FSL, 162' FWL

SEC 31-T14S-R20E

KB ELEVATION:7465.4'
GR ELEVATION:7443 4'

2000

30007

4000

5000

6000

7000

8000

1 MD Start Drop -1.50

90007
1127 MD Start Hold

10000
L1000 1]

] LT WINGATE
120007 e = ST

45 L1 = % 13 UEEEE

1300 X 400 TARGET BOX [~ "LEBHL fof 1p462 MD TD
1300{) 5 &7 U L o L S ™Tr—TT

-1000 0 1000 2000 3000 4000

Vertical Section at 308.52° {2000ft/in]

PRI

-2500

i '300
) =R v
=T 1191 0°FBL, 162 FWL |
——1 SEC 31-TI48-R20E —
R D R e s il I &
] i i
T T T T T T T 500
-2000 -1500 -1000 -500 0 500

West(-)/East(+) [1000t/in]

T
/E\ M
| Magnetic Field
i/ Strength: 52532nT
i Dip Angle: 65.59°
Date: 1/23/2007
Model: bggm2006

Azimuths to True North
Magnetic North: 11.68°

TOTAL CORRECTION TO TRUE NORTH: 11.68°

TY L1
SECTION DETAILS

Sec MD Inc Az TVD +N/-S +E/-W DLeg  TFace VSec Target

] 000 000 30852 000 0.00 000 000 000 000

2 560 00 000 30852 560 00 000 000 000 000 000 KOP

3 141219 1704 30852 1399 68 78 36 -98 44 200 30852 12582 HOLD

4 899079 1704 30852 864542 1461 71 -1836 42 000 0.00 234714 DROP

5 10127 04 000 30852 9765 00 1566 19 -1967 68 150 18000 251490 HOLD

6 12462 04 000 30852 12100 00 1566 19 -1967 68 000 30852 251490 PBHL

CASING DETAILS
— i NORTH-BIDE —

No. TVD MD Name Size s iDE QF TGEHON
1 500.00 500.00 13 3/8" 13.375 I 1 M i
2 440000 455034 95/8" 9.625 PBHL [
3 1210000 12462.04 51/2" 5.500 1 1566, 19' N, 1967 .68' W 1500

South(-)/North(-+) [1000ft/in]

SITE DETAILS
FR #7P-36-14-19

Site Centre Latitude:
Longitude:

Ground Level:

Positional Uncertainty

Convergence:

39°33'13.830N
109°43'46.040W

7443.40
: 0.00
1.17

FORMATION TOP DETAILS

Z
)

TVDPath  MDPath
2410.00
4365.00
6235.00
6925.00

10265.00

10360.00

10440.00

10650.00

11205.00

11285.00

11610.00

11820.00

246892
4513.73
6469.63
719133
10627.04
10722.04
10802.04
11012.04
11567.04
11647.04
11972 04
12182.04

DI B W —

Formation

WASATCH
MESA VERDE
CASTLE GATE
MANCOS
DAKOTA SILT
DAKOTA
CEDAR MOUNTAIN
MORRISON
CURTIS
ENTRADA
CARMEL
WINGATE

Plan: Plan #1 (FR #7P-36-14-19/1)
Created By: ROBERT H. SCOTT

Date: 1/23/2007




WEATHERFORD DRILLING SERVICES

WELL PLAN REPORT
Company: QUESTAR Date:  1/23/2007 Time: 17:33:36 Page: 1
Field: UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH Co-ordinate(NE) Reference: Site: FR #7P-36-14-19, True North
Site: FR #7P-36-14-19 Vertical (TVD) Reference: KB 7465.4
Well: FR #7P-36-14-19 Section (VS) Reference: Well (0.00N,0.00E,308.52Azi)
Wellpath: 1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature Db: Sybase
Plan: Plan #1 Date Composed: 1/23/2007
Version: 1
Principal: Yes Tied-to: From Surface
Field: UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
Map System:US State Plane Coordinate System 1983 Map Zone: Utah, Northern Zone
Geo Datum: GRS 1980 Coordinate System: Site Centre
Sys Datum: Mean Sea Level Geomagnetic Model: bggm2006
Well: FR #7P-36-14-19 Slot Name:
Well Position: +N/-S 0.00 ft Northing: 3001909.11 ft  Latitude: 39 33 13.830 N
+E/-W 0.00 ft Easting: 213983545 ft Longitude: 109 43 46.040 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.00 ft
Wellpath: 1 Drilled From: Surface
Tie-on Depth: 0.00 it
Current Datum: KB Height 746540 ft  Above System Datum:  Mean Sea Level
Magnetic Data: 1/23/2007 Declination: 11.68 deg
Field Strength: 52532 nT Mag Dip Angle: 65.59 deg
Vertical Section: Depth From (TVD) +N/-S +E/-W Direction
ft ft ft deg
0.00 0.00 0.00 308.52
Site: FR #7P-36-14-19
Site Position: Northing: 3001909.11 ft  Latitude: 39 33 13.830 N
From: Geographic Easting: 213983545 ft  Longitude: 109 43 46.040 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.00 ft North Reference: True
Ground Level: 7443.40 ft Grid Convergence: 1.17 deg
Plan Section Information
MD Incl Azim TVD +N/-S +E/-W DLS Build Turn TFO  Target
ft deg deg it ft it deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft  deg
0.00 0.00 308.52 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
560.00 0.00 308.52 560.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1412.19 17.04 308.52 1399.68 78.36 -98.44 2.00 2.00 0.00 308.52
8990.79 17.04 308.52  8645.42 1461.71 -1836.42 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
10127.04 0.00 308.52  9765.00 1566.19 -1967.68 1.50 -1.50 0.00 180.00
12462.04 0.00 308.52 12100.00 1566.19 -1967.68 0.00 0.00 0.00 308.52
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD N/S E/W A\ DLS Build Turn Comment
ft deg deg ft ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft
560.00 0.00 308.52 560.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 KOP
660.00 2.00 308.52 659.98 1.09 -1.37 1.75 2.00 2.00 0.00
760.00 4.00 308.52 759.84 4.35 -5.46 6.98 2.00 2.00 0.00
860.00 6.00 308.52 859.45 9.77 -12.28 15.69 2.00 2.00 0.00
960.00 8.00 308.52 958.70 17.36 -21.81 27.88 2.00 2.00 0.00
1060.00 10.00 308.52 1057.47 27.10 -34.05 43.52 2.00 2.00 0.00
1160.00 12.00 308.52 1155.62 38.99 -48.98 62.60 2.00 2.00 0.00
1260.00 14.00 308.52 1253.06 53.00 -66.58 85.10 2.00 2.00 0.00
1360.00 16.00 308.52 1349.64 69.11 -86.83  110.98 2.00 2.00 0.00
1412.19 17.04 308.52 1399.68 78.36 -9844  125.82 2.00 2.00 0.00 HOLD
1460.00 17.04 308.52 1445.39 87.08 -109.41 139.83 0.00 0.00 0.00
1560.00 17.04 308.52 1541.00 10534 -132.34 169.14 0.00 0.00 0.00
1660.00 17.04 308.52 1636.60 123.59 -155.27 198.45 0.00 0.00 0.00
1760.00 17.04 308.52 173221  141.84 -178.20 227.76 0.00 0.00 0.00
1860.00 17.04 308.52 1827.82 160.10 -201.14  257.07 0.00 0.00 0.00




WEATHERFORD DRILLING SERVICES
WELL PLAN REPORT

Company: QUESTAR

Field: UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

Date:

1/23/2007

Time: 17:33:36 Page: 2

Co-ordinate(NE) Reference: Site: FR #7P-36-14-19, True North

Site: FR #7P-36-14-19 Vertical (TVD) Reference: KB 7465.4
Well: FR #7P-36-14-19 Section (VS) Reference: Well (0.00N,0.00E,308.52Azi)
Wellpath: 1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature Db: Sybase
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD N/S E/W AL DLS Build Turn Comment
ft deg deg ft ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft
1960.00 17.04 308.52 192343 178.35 -224.07 286.38 0.00 0.00 0.00
2060.00 17.04 308.52 2019.04 196.60 -247.00 315.69 0.00 0.00 0.00
2160.00 17.04 308.52 211464 21486 -269.94  345.01 0.00 0.00 0.00
2260.00 17.04 308.52 2210.25 23311 -292.87 374.32 0.00 0.00 0.00
2360.00 17.04 308.52 2305.86 251.36 -315.80 403.63 0.00 0.00 0.00
2460.00 17.04 308.52 240147 269.62 -338.73  432.94 0.00 0.00 0.00
2468.92 17.04 308.52 241000 271.25 -340.78  435.55 0.00 0.00 0.00 WASATCH
2560.00 17.04 308.52 2497.08 287.87 -361.67 462.25 0.00 0.00 0.00
2660.00 17.04 308.52 250268 306.12 -384.60 491.56 0.00 0.00 0.00
2760.00 17.04 308.52 2688.29 32438 -407.53  520.87 0.00 0.00 0.00
2860.00 17.04 308.52 2783.90 34263 -430.46 550.18 0.00 0.00 0.00
2960.00 17.04 308.52 287951 360.88 -453.40 579.49 0.00 0.00 0.00
3060.00 17.04 308.52 297512 37914 -476.33  608.80 0.00 0.00 0.00
3160.00 17.04 308.52 3070.72 397.39 499.26  638.11 0.00 0.00 0.00
3260.00 17.04 308.52 3166.33 41565 -522.20 667.42 0.00 0.00 0.00
3360.00 17.04 308.52 326194 43390 -545.13 696.73 0.00 0.00 0.00
3460.00 17.04 308.52 335756 45215 -568.06  726.04 0.00 0.00 0.00
3560.00 17.04 308.52 3453.16 47041 -590.99 755.35 0.00 0.00 0.00
3660.00 17.04 308.52 3548.76 488.66 -613.93 784.66 0.00 0.00 0.00
3760.00 17.04 308.52 3644.37 506.91 -636.86 813.97 0.00 0.00 0.00
3860.00 17.04 308.52 3739.98 52517 -659.79  843.28 0.00 0.00 0.00
3960.00 17.04 308.52 383559 54342 68272 872.59 0.00 0.00 0.00
4060.00 17.04 308.52 3931.20 561.67 -705.66  901.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
4160.00 17.04 308.52 4026.80 579.93 -72859  931.21 0.00 0.00 0.00
4260.00 17.04 308.52 4122.41 598.18 -751.52 960.52 0.00 0.00 0.00
4360.00 17.04 308.52 4218.02 61643 -774.46  989.83 0.00 0.00 0.00
4460.00 17.04 308.52 431363 63469 -797.39 1019.14 0.00 0.00 0.00
4513.73 17.04 308.52 4365.00 644.49 -809.71 1034.89 0.00 0.00 0.00 MESA VERDE
4550.34 17.04 308.52 4400.00 651.18 -818.11 1045.62 0.00 0.00 0.00 95/8"
4560.00 17.04 308.52 4409.24 652.94 -820.32 1048.46 0.00 0.00 0.00
4660.00 17.04 308.52 4504.85 67119 -843.25 1077.77 0.00 0.00 0.00
4760.00 17.04 308.52 460045 689.45 -866.19 1107.08 0.00 0.00 0.00
4860.00 17.04 308.52 4696.06 707.70 -889.12 1136.39 0.00 0.00 0.00
4960.00 17.04 308.52 479167 72595 -912.05 1165.70 0.00 0.00 0.00
5060.00 17.04 308.52 4887.28 74421 -934.98 1195.01 0.00 0.00 0.00
5160.00 17.04 308.52 4982.89 76246 -957.92 1224.32 0.00 0.00 0.00
5260.00 17.04 308.52 5078.49 780.71 -980.85 1253.63 0.00 0.00 0.00
5360.00 17.04 308.52 517410 798.97 -1003.78 1282.94 0.00 0.00 0.00
5460.00 17.04 308.52 5260.71  817.22 -1026.72 1312.25 0.00 0.00 0.00
5560.00 17.04 308.52 5365.32 83548 -1049.65 134156 0.00 0.00 0.00
5660.00 17.04 308.52 5460.93 853.73 -1072.58 1370.87 0.00 0.00 0.00
5760.00 17.04 308.52 5556.53 871.98 -1095.51 1400.18 0.00 0.00 0.00
5860.00 17.04 308.52 5652.14 890.24 -1118.45 142949 0.00 0.00 0.00
5960.00 17.04 308.52 574775 908.49 -1141.38 1458.80 0.00 0.00 0.00
6060.00 17.04 308.52 5843.36 926.74 -1164.31 1488.11 0.00 0.00 0.00
6160.00 17.04 308.52 5938.97 945.00 -1187.25 1517.42 0.00 0.00 0.00
6260.00 17.04 308.52 603457 96325 -1210.18 1546.73 0.00 0.00 0.00
6360.00 17.04 308.52 6130.18  981.50 -1233.11 1576.04 0.00 0.00 0.00
6460.00 17.04 308.52 622579 999.76 -1256.04 1605.35 0.00 0.00 0.00
6469.63 17.04 308.52 6235.00 1001.52 -1258.25 1608.18 0.00 0.00 0.00 CASTLE GATE
6560.00 17.04 308.52 632140 1018.01 -1278.98 1634.66 0.00 0.00 0.00
6660.00 17.04 308.52 6417.01 1036.26 -1301.91 1663.97 0.00 0.00 0.00
6760.00 17.04 308.52 6512.61 1054.52 -1324.84 1693.28 0.00 0.00 0.00




WEATHERFORD DRILLING SERVICES
WELL PLAN REPORT

Company: QUESTAR

Field: UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

Date:

1/23/2007

Time: 17:33:36 Page: 3

Co-ordinate(NE) Reference: Site: FR #7P-36-14-19, True North

Site: FR #7P-36-14-19 Vertical (TVD) Reference: KB 7465.4
Wellk: FR #7P-36-14-19 Section (VS) Reference: Well (0.00N,0.00E,308.52Azi)
Wellpath: 1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature Db: Sybase
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD N/S E/W VS DLS Build Tuarn Comment
ft deg deg ft it it it deg/100it  deg/100ft deg/100ft
6860.00 17.04 308.52 6608.22 1072.77 -1347.77 1722.59 0.00 0.00 0.00
6960.00 17.04 308.52 6703.83 1091.02 -1370.71 1751.91 0.00 0.00 0.00
7060.00 17.04 308.52 6799.44 1109.28 -1393.64 1781.22 0.00 0.00 0.00
7160.00 17.04 308.52 6895.05 1127.53 -1416.57 1810.53 0.00 0.00 0.00
7191.33 17.04 308.52 6925.00 1133.25 -1423.76 1819.71 0.00 0.00 0.00 MANCOS
7260.00 17.04 308.52 6980.65 1145.78 -1439.51 1839.84 0.00 0.00 0.00
7360.00 17.04 308.52 7086.26 1164.04 -1462.44 1869.15 0.00 0.00 0.00
7460.00 17.04 308.52 7181.87 118229 -1485.37 1898.46 0.00 0.00 0.00
7560.00 17.04 308.52 7277.48 1200.55 -1508.30 1927.77 0.00 0.00 0.00
7660.00 17.04 308.52 7373.09 1218.80 -1531.24 1957.08 0.00 0.00 0.00
7760.00 17.04 308.52 7468.69 1237.05 -1554.17 1986.39 0.00 0.00 0.00
7860.00 17.04 308.52 7564.30 1255.31 -1577.10 2015.70 0.00 0.00 0.00
7960.00 17.04 308.52 7650.91 1273.56 -1600.03 2045.01 0.00 0.00 0.00
8060.00 17.04 308.52 7755.52 1291.81 -1622.97 2074.32 0.00 0.00 0.00
8160.00 17.04 308.52 785113 1310.07 -164590 2103.63 0.00 0.00 0.00
8260.00 17.04 308.52 7946.73 1328.32 -1668.83 2132.94 0.00 0.00 0.00
8360.00 17.04 308.52 8042.34 1346.57 -1691.77 2162.25 0.00 0.00 0.00
8460.00 17.04 308.52 8137.95 1364.83 -1714.70 2191.56 0.00 0.00 0.00
8560.00 17.04 308.52 8233.56 1383.08 -1737.63 2220.87 0.00 0.00 0.00
8660.00 17.04 308.52 8329.17 1401.33 -1760.56 2250.18 0.00 0.00 0.00
8760.00 17.04 308.52 8424.78 141959 -1783.50 2279.49 0.00 0.00 0.00
8860.00 17.04 308.52 8520.38 1437.84 -1806.43 2308.80 0.00 0.00 0.00
8960.00 17.04 308.52 861599 1456.09 -1829.36 2338.11 0.00 0.00 0.00
8990.79 17.04 308.52 864542 1461.71 -1836.42 2347.14 0.00 0.00 0.00 DROP
9060.00 16.01 308.52 8711.78 1473.97 -1851.83 2366.82 1.50 -1.50 0.00
9160.00 14.51 308.52 8808.25 1490.36 -1872.41 2393.14 1.50 -1.50 0.00
9260.00 13.01 308.52 8905.38 1505.17 -1891.02 2416.91 1.50 -1.50 0.00
9360.00 11.51 308.52 9003.10 15618.39 -1907.62 2438.14 1.50 -1.50 0.00
9460.00 10.01 308.52 9101.34 15630.01 -192222 2456.80 1.50 -1.50 0.00
9560.00 8.51 308.52 9200.04 1540.02 -1934.81 2472.88 1.50 -1.50 0.00
9660.00 7.01 308.52 9299.12 1548.43 -1945.37 2486.38 1.50 -1.50 0.00
9760.00 5.51 308.52 9398.52 15655.21 -1953.89 2497.28 1.50 -1.50 0.00
9860.00 4.01 308.52 9498.17 1560.38 -1960.38 2505.57 1.50 -1.50 0.00
9960.00 2.51 308.52 9598.01 1563.91 -1964.82 2511.25 1.50 -1.50 0.00
10060.00 1.01 308.52 9697.96 1565.82 -1967.22 2514.31 1.50 -1.50 0.00
10127.04 0.00 308.52 9765.00 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 1.50 -1.50 0.00 HOLD
10160.00 0.00 308.52 9797.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
10260.00 0.00 308.52 9897.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
10360.00 0.00 308.52 9997.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
10460.00 0.00 308.52 10097.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
10560.00 0.00 308.52 10197.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
10627.04 0.00 308.52 10265.00 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 000 TGTPT
10660.00 0.00 308.52 10297.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
10722.04 0.00 308.52 10360.00 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 DAKOTA
10760.00 0.00 308.52 10397.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
10802.04 0.00 308.52 10440.00 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 CEDAR MOUNTAIN
10860.00 0.00 308.52 10497.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
10960.00 0.00 308.52 10597.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
11012.04 0.00 308.52 10650.00 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 MORRISON
11060.00 0.00 308.52 10697.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
11160.00 0.00 308.52 10797.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
11260.00 0.00 308.52 10897.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00




WEATHERFORD DRILLING SERVICES

WELL PLAN REPORT
Company: QUESTAR Date:  1/23/2007 Time: 17:33:36 Page: 4
Field: UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH Co-ordinate(NE) Reference: Site: FR #7P-36-14-19, True North
Site: FR #7P-36-14-19 Vertical (TVD) Reference: KB 7465.4
Well: FR #7P-36-14-19 Section (VS) Reference: Well (0.00N,0.00E,308.52Azi)
Wellpath: 1 . Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature Db: Sybase
Survey
MD Incl Azim TVD N/S E/W A\ DLS Build Turn Comment
ft deg deg ft ft ft ft deg/100ft deg/100ft deg/100ft

11360.00 0.00 308.562 10997.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00

11460.00 0.00 308.52 11097.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00

11560.00 0.00 308.52 1119796 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00

11667.04 0.00 308.562 11205.00 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 CURTIS
11647.04 0.00 308.562 11285.00 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 ENTRADA

11660.00 0.00 308.52 11297.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
11760.00 0.00 308.52 11397.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
11860.00 0.00 308.52 11497.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
11960.00 0.00 308.562 11597.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
11972.04 0.00 308.52 11610.00 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 CARMEL

12060.00 0.00 308.52 11697.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
12160.00 0.00 308.52 11797.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
12182.04 0.00 308.52 11820.00 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 WINGATE
12260.00 0.00 308.52 11897.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
12360.00 0.00 308.52 11997.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00

12460.00 0.00 308.52 12097.96 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00
12462.04 0.00 308.52 12100.00 1566.19 -1967.68 2514.90 0.00 0.00 0.00 PBHL

Targets
Map Map <~ Latitude —-> <-—- Longitude --->
Name Description TVD +N/-S +E/-W Northing Easting Deg Min Sec Deg Min Sec
Dip. Dir. ft ft ft ft ft
TGT PT 10265.00 1666.19 -1967.68 3003434.892137836.27 39 3329.302N 109 44 11.153 W
-Plan hit target
PBHL 12100.00 1386.18 -2147.68 3003251.252137659.98 39 3327523 N 109 44 13450 W
-Rectangle (400x400)
-Plan out by 254.56 at 12100.00 15666.19 -1967.68 3003434.892137836.27 39 3329302N 109 44 11153 W
Annotation
MD TVD
ft ft
560.00 560.00 KOP
141219  1399.68 HOLD
8990.79 8645.42 DROP
10127.04 9765.00 HOLD
12462.04 12100.00 PBHL
Formations
MD TVD Formations Lithology Dip Angle Dip Direction
ft ft deg deg
2468.92  2410.00 WASATCH 0.00 0.00
4513.73  4365.00 MESA VERDE 0.00 0.00
6469.63 6235.00 CASTLE GATE 0.00 0.00
7191.33 6925.00 MANCOS 0.00 0.00
10627.04 10265.00 DAKOTA SILT 0.00 0.00
10722.04 10360.00 DAKOTA 0.00 0.00
10802.04 10440.00 CEDAR MOUNTAIN 0.00 0.00
11012.04 10650.00 MORRISON 0.00 0.00
11567.04 11205.00 CURTIS 0.00 0.00
11647.04 11285.00 ENTRADA 0.00 0.00
11972.04 11610.00 CARMEL 0.00 0.00

12182.04 11820.00 WINGATE 0.00 0.00
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Company: QUESTAR Date:  1/23/2007 Time: 17:33:36 Page: 5
Field: UINTAH.COUNTY, UTAH Co-ordinate(NE) Reference: Site: FR #7P-36-14-19, True North
Site: FR #7P-36-14-19 Vertical (TVD) Reference: KB 7465.4
Well: FR #7P-36-14-19 Section (VS) Reference: Well (0.00N,0.00E,308.52Azi)
Wellpath: 1 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature Db: Sybase

Casing Points

MD TVD Diameter Hole Size Name
ft ft in in
500.00 500.00 13.375 17.500 13 3/8"

4550.34  4400.00 9.625 12.250 9 5/8"

12462.04 12100.00 5.500 6.000 51/2"




Q. E. P.
1050 17th Street Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

FR 7P-36-14-19

Flat Rock Field

Uintah County, Utah
United States of America
S:5 T:9S R:22E

Cementing Recommendation

Prepared for: Mr. Jim Davidson
January 18, 2007
Version: 1

Submitted by:

Aaron James

Halliburton Energy Services
1125 17th Street

Suite 1900

Denver, Colorado 80202
307.362.6311

HALLIBURTON

Proposal FR 7P-36-14-19 v.1




«

1]

HALLIBUR'&JN

Halliburton appreciates the opportunity to present
this proposal and looks forward to being of service to you.

Foreword

Enclosed is our recommended procedure for cementing the casing strings in the referenced well.
The information in this proposal includes well data, calculations, materials requirements, and cost
estimates. This proposal is based on information from our field personnel and previous cementing
services in the area. ‘

Halliburton Energy Services recognizes the importance of meeting society's needs for health,
safety, and protection of the environment. It is our intention to proactively work with employees,
customers, the public, governments, and others to use natural resources in an environmentally sound
manner while protecting the health, safety, and environmental processes while supplying high quality
products and services to our customers.

We appreciate the opportunity to present this proposal for your consideration and we look
forward to being of service to you. Our Services for your well will be coordinated through the Service
Center listed below. If you require any additional information or additional designs, please feel free to
contact myself or our field representative listed below.

Remember the Basics of Cementing:

-Annular Energy -Mud Properties (PV, YP, FL, GS)
-Spacers / Fllushes -Pipe Centralization
-Plug System -Communication
Prepared by:
Ginette Ishida

Proposal Specialist

Submitted by:
Aaron James
Technical Advisor
SERVICE CENTER: Vernal, Utah
SERVICE COORDINATOR: Willis Lefevre / Kyle Scott
OPER. ENGINEER: Carl Carlson
FSQC: Lex Cook
CMT ENGINEER Douglas Harding
PHONE NUMBER: (435) 789-2550

Q.E.P. FR 7P-36-14-19
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Cementing Best Practices

1. Cement quality and weight: You must choose a cement shurry that is designed to solve the problems
specific to each casing string.

2. Waiting time: You must hold the cement slurry in place and under pressure until it reaches its' initial set
without disturbing it. A cement slurry is a time-dependent liquid and must be allowed to undergo a hydration
reaction to produce a competent cement sheath. A fresh cement slurry can be worked (thickening or pump time) as
long as it is in a plastic state and before going through its' transition phase. If the cement shurry is not allowed to
transition without being disturbed, it may be subjected to changes in density, dilution, settling, water separation, and
gas cutting that may lead to a lack of zonal isolation and possible bridging in the annulus.

3. . Pipe movement: Pipe movement may be one of the single most influential factors in mud removal.
Reciprocation and/or rotation mechanically breaks up gelled mud and changes the flow patterns in the annulus to
improve displacement efficiency.

4. Mud properties (for cementing):
Rheology:

Plastic Viscosity (PV) < 15 centipoise (cp)

Yield Point (YP) < 10 Ib/100 ft2

These properties should be reviewed with the Mud Engineer, Drilling Engineer, and Company

Representative(s) to ensure no hole problems are created.

Gel Strength:

The 10-second/10-minute gel strength values should be such that the 10-second and 10-minute  readings
are close together or flat (i.e., 5/6). The 30-minute reading should be less than 20 1b/100 fi2, Sufficient shear stress
may not be achieved on a primary cement job to remove mud left in the hole if the mud were to develop
more than 25 1b/100 ft* of gel strength.

Fluid Loss:

Decreasing the filtrate loss into a permeable zone enhances the creation of a thin, competent filter cake. A
thin, competent filter cake created by a low fluid loss mud system is desirable over a thick, partially gelled filter
cake. A mud system created with a low fluid loss will be more easily  displaced. The fluid loss value should be <
15 cc's (ideal would be 5 cc's).

5. Circulation: Prior to cementing circulate full hole volume twice, or until well conditioned mud is being
returned to the surface. There should be no cutting in the mud returns. An annular velocity of 260 feet per minute
is optimum (SPE/IADC 18617), if possible.

6. Flow rate: Turbulent flow is the most desirable flow regime for mud removal. If turbulence cannot be
achieved pump at as high a flow rate that can practically and safely be used to create the maximum flow energy.
The highest mud removal is achieved when the maximum flow energy is obtained.

7. Pipe Centralization: This Cement will take the path of least resistance, therefore proper centralization is
important to help prevent the casing from contacting the borehole wall. A minimum standoff of 70% should be
targeted for optimum displacement efficiency.

8. Rathole: A weighted viscous pill placed in the rat hole prior to cementing will minimize the risk of higher
density cement mixing with lower density mud when the well is static.

9. Top and Bottom plugs: A top and bottom plug are recommended to be run on all primary casing jobs. The
bottom plug should be run after the spacer and ahead of the first cement slhurry.

10. Spacers and flushes: Spacers and/or flushes should be used to prevent contamination between the cement
slurry and the drilling fluid. They are also used to clean the wellbore and aid with bonding. To determine the
volume, either a minimum of 10 minutes contact time or 1000 ft. of annular fill, whichever is greater, is
recommended.

Q.E.P. FR 7P-36-14-19
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Job Information

Cement Surface Casing

FR 7P-36-14-19

13-3/8" Surface Casing
Outer Diameter
Inner Diameter
Linear Weight
Casing Grade

17-1/2" Surface Open Hole

Inner Diameter
Job Excess

Mud Type

Q.E.P.

0 - 500 ft (MD)
0 - 500 ft (TVD)
13.375 in
12.715 in

48 Tbm/ft

H-40

0 - 500 ft (MD)
0 - 500 ft (TVD)
17.500 in

100 %

Air

FR 7P-36-14-19
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Job Recommendation

Cement Surface Casing

Fluid Instructions
Fluid 1: Water Based Spacer
Gel Water Fluid Density:
Fluid Volume:
Fluid 2: Primary Cement
Rockies LT Cement Fluid Weight
0.25 Ibm/sk Kwik Seal (Lost Circulation Additive) Slurry Yield:

0.125 Ibm/sk Poly-E-Flake (Lost Circulation Additive) Total Mixing Fluid:

Top of Fluid:
Calculated Fill:
Volume:
Calculated Sacks:
Proposed Sacks:
Fluid 3: Water Spacer

Water Displacement Fluid Density:
Fluid Volume:

Fluid 4: Top Out Cement
Premium Plus - Type III Fluid Weight
94 lbm/sk Premium Plus - Type III (Cement-api) Slurry Yield:
2 % Calcium Chloride (Accelerator) Total Mixing Fluid:
Proposed Sacks:

Q.E.P.

8.34 lbm/gal
20 bbl

13.50 Ibm/gal
1.80 ft'/sk
9.33 Gal/sk
0ft

500 ft
130.32 bbl
405.81 sks
410 sks

8.34 Ibm/gal
71.93 bbl

14.50 Ibm/gal
1.41 ft¥/sk
6.86 Gal/sk
200 sks

FR 7P-36-14-19
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Job Procedure

Cement Surface Casing

Detailed Pumping Schedule

Q.E.P.

Fluid # Fluid Fluid Name Surface | Estimated | Downhole
g Type Density | AvgRate Volume
’ Ibm/gal bbl/min
1 Spacer  Gel Water 83 5.0 20 bbl
2 Cement Rockies LTCement 13.5 5.0 410 sks
3 Spacer  Water Displacement 83 5.0 71.93 bbl
4 Cement Top Out Cement 14.5 L5 200 sks
6

FR 7P-36-14-19
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Job Information

Cement Intermediate Casing

FR 7P-36-14-19

13-3/8" Surface Casing

Outer Diameter
Inner Diameter
Linear Weight
Casing Grade

12-1/4" Intermediate Open Hole
Inner Diameter
Job Excess

9-5/8" Intermediate Casing
Outer Diameter
Inner Diameter
Linear Weight
Casing Grade

Mud Type

Mud Weight
BHCT

Q.E.P.

0 - 500 ft (MD)
0 - 500 ft (TVD)
13.375 in
12.715 in

48 lom/ft

H-40

500 - 4400 ft (MD)
12.250 in
50%

0 - 4400 ft (MD)
9.625 in

8.835 in

40 Tbm/ft

3-55

Aerated

8.40 1bm/gal
95 degF

FR 7P-36-14-19
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Job Recommendation

Cement Intermediate Casing

Fluid Instructions
Fluid 1: Water Spacer
Fresh Water Ahead

Fluid 2: Reactive Spacer
Super Flush
Fluid 3: Water Spacer

Fresh Water Behind

Fluid 4: Foamed Lead Cement
50/50 Poz Premium

0.1 % HAILAD-766 (Low Fluid Loss Control)
5 Ibm/sk Silicalite Compacted (Light Weight Additive) Total Mixing Fluid:
20 % SSA-1 (Cement Material)

0.1 % Versaset (Thixotropic Additive)
1.5 % Zonesealant 2000 (Foamer)

Fluid 5: Foamed Lead Cement
50/50 Poz Premium

0.1 % HALAD-766 (L.ow Fluid Loss Control)
5 Ibm/sk Silicalite Compacted (Light Weight Additive) Total Mixing Fluid:

Fluid Density:
Fluid Volume:

Fluid Density:
50 Ibm/bbl  Halliburton Super Flush (Flush/spacer Additive)Fluid Volume:
42 Ibm/bbl  Fresh Water (Base Fluid)

Fluid Density:
Fluid Volume:

Fluid Weight
Slurry Yield:

Top of Fluid:
Calculated Fill:
Volume:
Calculated Sacks:
Proposed Sacks:

Fluid Weight
Slurry Yield:

20 % SSA-1 (Cement Material) Top of Fluid:
0.1 % Versaset (Thixotropic Additive) Calculated Fill:
1.5% Zonesealant 2000 (Foamer) Volume:
Calculated Sacks:
Proposed Sacks:

Fluid 6: Tail Cement
50/50 Poz Premium Fluid Weight
0.1 % HALAD-766 (Low Fluid Loss Control) Shurry Yield:

5 Ibm/sk Silicalite Compacted (Light Weight Additive) Total Mixing Fluid:

20 % SSA-1 (Cement Material) Top of Fluid:
0.1 % Versaset (Thixotropic Additive) Calculated Fill:
Volume:

Calculated Sacks:

Proposed Sacks:

10

Q.E.P.

8.34 Ibm/gal
10 bbl

9.20 Ibm/gal
20 bbl
8.34 Ibm/gal

10 bbl

"?( +
4
14.30 Tbm/gal Vch

147 fe/sk 4.
6.39 Gal/sk v
0ft < JY

\ 42z
2200 fi b s
175.77bbl X7 577
391.77 sks i
400 sks 2\

.3‘%% v’\b
a \ gﬂf‘
15 [ \ \P\\'

1430 Ibm/gal v &
147 £k ¥
6.39 Gallsk (0¥
2200 ft

47
1700 ft ®
142.24 bbl + 5 .\0\440 mé %71'

408.91 sks
410 sks

14.30 Ibm/gal
1.47 f*/sk
6.39 Gal/sk
3900 ft

500 ft

45.02 bbl
172.07 sks
180 sks

FR 7P-36-14-19



HALLIBUR'I%N

Fluid 7: Water Spacer
Displacement Fluid Density: ~ 8.34 lbm/gal
Fluid Volume:  307.70 bbl

Fluid 8: Top Out Cement

Premium Cement Fluid Weight  14.60 lbm/gal
94 1bm/sk Premium Cement (Cement) Slurry Yield:  1.55 ft'/sk
12 % Cal-Seal 60 (Accelerator) Total Mixing Fluid:  7.35 Gal/sk
3 % Calcium Chloride (Accelerator) Proposed Sacks: 75 sks
11

Q.E.P. FR 7P-36-14-19
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Job Procedure

Cement Intermediate Casing

Detailed Pumping Schedule

~Flid# .| Fhid Fluid Name Surface | Estimated | Downhole
G Type Density | -AvgRate | Volume
Tom/gal bbl/min
1 Spacer  Fresh Water Ahead 83 5.0 10 bbl
2 Spacer  Super Flush 9.2 5.0 20 bbl
3 Spacer  Fresh Water Behind 8.3 5.0 10 bbl
4 Cement 8.5 ppg Foamed Cement 14.3 5.0 400 sks
5 Cement 11 ppg Foamed Cement 14.3 5.0 410 sks
6 Cement Unfoamed Tail 14.3 5.0 180 sks
7 Spacer  Displacement 8.3 7.0 307.70 bbl
8 Cement Cap Cement 14.6 1.5 75 sks
Foam Output Parameter Summary:
Fluid # Fluid Name Unfoame | Beginning | Ending | Beginning | Ending
d Liquid Density Density Rate Rate
Volume Ibm/gal Ibm/gal scf/bbl scf/bbl
Stage 1
4 8.5 ppg Foamed Cement 102.50bb 8.5 8.5 23.3 288.6
1
5 11 ppg Foamed Cement 106.99bb 11.0 11.0 125.0 246.2
1
Foam Design Specifications:
Foam Calculation Method: Constant Density Calculated Gas = 35936.0 scf
Backpressure: 75 psig Additional Gas= 40000 scf
Bottom Hole Circulating Temp: 95 degF Total Gas = 75936.0 scf
Mud Outlet Temperature: 80 degF

12

Q.E.P. FR 7P-36-14-19
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Job Information

Cement Production Casing

FR 7P-36-14-19

9-5/8" Intermediate Casing
Outer Diameter
Inner Diameter
Linear Weight
Casing Grade

8-1/2" Production Open Hole
Inner Diameter

5-1/2" Production Casing
Outer Diameter
Inner Diameter
Linear Weight
Casing Grade
Job Excess

Mud Type
Mud Weight
BHST
BHCT

Q.E.P.

0 - 4400 ft (MD)
9.625 in

8.835 in

40 Tbm/ft

J-55

4400 - 12462 ft (MD)
8.500 in

0 - 12462 ft (MD)
5.500 in

4.892 in

17 Ibm/ft

P-110

40 %

Water Based Mud
9.50 1bm/gal

210 degF

160 degF

16
FR 7P-36-14-19
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Job Recommendation

Cement Production Casing

Fluid Instructions
Fluid 1: Water Spacer
Fresh Water Ahead

Fluid 2: Reactive Spacer
Super Flush

Fluid 3: Water Spacer
Fresh Water Behind

Fluid 4: Foamed Lead Cement
50/50 Poz Premium

0.3 % HALAD-766 (Low Fluid Loss Control)

5 Ibm/sk Silicalite Compacted (Light Weight Additive) Total Mixing Fluid:

20 % SSA-1 (Cement Material)
0.2 % Versaset (Thixotropic Additive)
1.5% Zonesealant 2000 (Foamer)

Fluid 5: Tail Cement
50/50 Poz Premium

0.3 % HALAD-766 (Low Fluid Loss Control)

5 Ibm/sk Silicalite Compacted (Light Weight Additive) Total Mixing Fluid:

20 % SSA-1 (Cement Material)
0.2 % Versaset (Thixotropic Additive)
1.5 % Zonesealant 2000 (Foamer)

Fluid 6: Water Spacer
Displacement

Fluid 7: Top Out Cement

Premium Cement
94 Ibm/sk Premium Cement (Cement)
12 % Cal-Seal 60 (Accelerator)
3 % Calcium Chloride (Accelerator)

Q.E.P.

Fluid Density: ~ 8.34 lbm/gal
Fluid Volume: 10 bbl
Fluid Density: ~ 9.20 lbm/gal
Fluid Volume: 20 bbl
Fluid Density: ~ 8.34 1bm/gal
Fluid Volume: 10 bbl
Fluid Weight  14.30 lbm/gal
Slurry Yield:  1.47 f¥/sk
6.39 Gal/sk
Top of Fluid: 4000 ft
Calculated Fill: 8157 ft
Volume:  335.06 bbl
Calculated Sacks:  931.03 sks
Proposed Sacks: 940 sks
N
Fluid Weight ~ 14.30 Ibm/gal g
Slurry Yield: 147 ff/sk _ ¢ 7
6.39 Gal/sk*
Top of Fluid: 12157 ft
Calculated Fill: 500 ft
Volume: 21.38 bbl
Calculated Sacks:  81.59 sks
Proposed Sacks: 90 sks
Fluid Density:  8.34 lbm/gal
Fluid Volume:  293.27 bbl
Fluid Weight  14.60 Ibm/gal
Slurry Yield: 1.5 fi’/sk
Total Mixing Fluid: ~ 7.35 Gal/sk
Proposed Sacks: 75 sks

17
FR 7P-36-14-19
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HALLIBURTON

Job Procedure Cement Production Casing

Detailed Pumping Schedule

- Fluid # Fluid Fluid Name Surface | Estimated | Downhole
' ‘ Type Density | AvgRate | Volume
; Ibm/gal bbl/min
1 Spacer  Fresh Water Ahead 83 5.0 10 bbl
2 Spacer  Super Flush 9.2 5.0 20 bbl
3 Spacer  Fresh Water Behind 83 5.0 10 bbl
4 Cement Foamed Lead 143 5.0 940 sks
5 Cement Unfoamed Tail 143 5.0 90 sks
6 Spacer  Displacement 83 7.0 293.27 bbl
7 Cement 12/3 Thixo 14.6 1.5 75 sks

Foam Output Parameter Summary:

Fluid # Fluid Name Unfoame | Beginning | Ending | Beginning | Ending
d Liquid Density Density Rate Rate
Volume Tbm/gal Ibm/gal scf/bbl scf/bbl
Stage 1
4 Foamed Lead 243.93bb 11.0 11.0 2225 686.2

1

Foam Design Specifications:

Foam Calculation Method: Constant Density Calculated Gas = 112630.2 scf
Backpressure: 75 psig Additional Gas = 40000 scf
Bottom Hole Circulating Temp: 180 degF Total Gas = 152630.2 scf

Mud Outlet Temperature: 120 degF

18
Q.E.P. FR 7P-36-14-19



Lessee’s or Operator’s Representative:

Jan Nelson
Red Wash Rep.
Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
1571 E. 1700 S.
Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4032

Certification:

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved
plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

Questar Explor. & Prod. Co. will be fully responsible for the actions of their subcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drill will be furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all
construction and drilling operations.

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access route; that | am familiar with the conditions which currently
exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by Questar Explor. & Prod. Co. its’ contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. This statement is
subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

lj &7\ 23-Jan-07

/  Jan NelsoR e Date
Red Wash Representative
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WORKSHEET !
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 01/25/2007 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-38992

WELL NAME: FR 7P-36-14-19

OPERATOR : QUESTAR EXPLORATION & ( N5085 ) PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4032
CONTACT : JAN NELSON
PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
NWSW 31 1408 200E Tech Review . Initials Date
SURFACE: 1910 FSL 0162 FWL B
QuuE BOTTOM: 1800 FNL 1800 FEL Sre i (A4 Engineering §>0¢4E> %éz%ﬁjf?
COUNTY:  UINTAH ;
Geology
LATITUDE: 39.55398 LONGITUDE: -109.7287
UTM SURF EASTINGS: 609230 NORTHINGS: 4378818 Surface
FIELD NAME: FLAT ROCK {( 600 )
LEASE TYPE: 3 - State
LEASE NUMBER: ML-49279 PROPOSED FORMATION : WINGT
SURFACE OWNER: 2 - Indian COALBED METHANE WELL? NO
RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:
Plat R649-2-3.
Bond: Fed[] Ind[] Stal] Feell .
o~ Unit:
) 5063 033 )
A potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General
] [ 0il shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
v Water permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No. 49-2183 ) o ,
| - Drilling Unit
(8 RDCC Review (Y/N) -
Board Cause No:
(Date: )
Eff Date:
L7 Fee surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:
i Intent to Commingl Y/N . . .
ﬁi&L* ommingle  (Y/N) lgf R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS :

STIPULATIONS: i“\ K//WQ}Au. mﬂlif

2 \\Saa,%\wf quﬂ"
2-Coma st pt2 ()" prob.dron, Yooo' Me) \
4 %TATEXV\B'\)T (I)V %msxs




BHL
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& e i
®
NHC uir
1-25-14-19 TRIBAI
FLAT ROCK UTE TRIBAL 2977
303A X( 304 (%
UTE TRIBAL
7-30-14-20
25 30 TTBAL
29-3A
UTE TRIBAL UTL TRIBAI X
3027 ~ 3034
HAT ROCK
13-29-14-20
urtt
TRIBAL
30-6A y Ul
TRIBAIL
29-1A
Uurk
L3 BHL R TRIBAI
3P-36-14-19 e 1P-36-14-19 3220 -
= @ BHL @ = A
3P-36-14-19
BHL FLAT ROCK FIELD
7P-36-14-19 urt
TRIBAL
32-3A -
N
E3 ~ * Ui1Fk
- . TRIBAI
BHIL. . 32-12A
1P-36-14-19 s ®— O .'J:‘, hoie
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@& TP Y419 Wic
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DEL-RIO\IOR!ON 32-BA
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Ti5S R20E T
Ti5S R19E . . :RHK
1P-1:(5-19 ool 1-6-15-20
@ N W 61520
P15
OPERATOR: QUESTAR EXPL & PROD (N5085)
SEC: 31 T.I4S R.20E ‘&
w N
FIELD: FLAT ROCK (600) ! 2
COUNTY: UINTAH %
SPACING: R649-3-11/ DIRECTIONAL DRILLING Wells Status
: B -~ GAS INJECTION { i
% COmhIa] Utah Oil Gas and Mining
x LOCATION ABANDONED
® NEW LOCATION N
Field Status UnitES)zgtLuS TSI < PLUGGED & ABANDONED
ABANDONED ¢ PRODUCING GAS
E ACTIVE GAS STORAGE ® PRODUCING OIL
NE PP OIL ~+ SHUT-IN GAS
1 COMBINED NF SECONDARY W E
i PENDING « SHUT-IN OIL .
] INACTIVE = PI OIL % TEMP. ABANDONED
[~} PROPOSED -
L PROPOSS! [ PP GAS © TESTWELL
= TERMINATED PP GEOTHERML & WATER INJECTION S
] PPOIL ® WATER SUPPLY PREPARED BY: DIANA MASON
[] SECONDARY w WATER DISPOSAL DATE: 26 JANUARY-2007
[ TERMINATED . DRILLING




‘ Appllcatlon for Pel:hlit to Drill
Statement of Basis

1/29/2007 Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Page 1
APD No API WellNo Status Well Type Surf Ownr CBM
218 43-047-38992-00-00 GW I No
Operator QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTIO Surface Owner-APD

Well Name FR 7P-36-14-19 Unit

Field FLAT ROCK Type of Work

Location NWSW 31 14S 20ES O FL 0 FL GPS Coord (UTM) 609230E 4378818N
Geologic Statement of Basis

QEP proposes to set 500" of surface casing and 4,400 feet of intermediate casing at this location. The depth to
the base of the moderately saline water at this location is estimated to be at a depth of 3700". A search of
Division of Water Rights records shows no water wells within a 10,000 foot radius of the proposed well. This
location lies on the Green River Formation. The proposed location is in a recharge area for the aquifers of the
upper Green River formation and fresh water can be expected to be found in the upper Green River. The
proposed casing and cement should adequately protect any useable ground water.

Brad Hill 1/29/2007
APD Evaluator Date / Time

Surface Statement of Basis

The surface rights at the proposed location are owned by the Ute Indian Tribe. The operator is responsible for
obtaining all required permits and rights-of-way prior to making any surface disturbance or drilling the well.

Brad Hill 1/29/2007
Onsite Evaluator Date / Time

Conditions of Approval / Application for Permit to Drill
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Well name: 2007-1 QEP FR 7P-36-14-19

Operator: Questar Exploration & Production, CO.

String type:  Surface Project ID:
43-047-38992

Location: Uintah County

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors:

Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 82 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 499 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 440 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psifft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 500 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)
Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:
Next setting depth: 4,256 ft
Tension is based on buoyed weight.  Next mud weight: 8.400 ppg
Neutral point: 438 ft Next setting BHP: 1,857 psi
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 500 ft
Injection pressure: 500 psi
Run  Segment Nominal End True Vert ' Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) () (in) (ft)

1 500 13.375 48.00 H-40 ST&C 500 500 12.59 440.7
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load  Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) {Kips) Factor

1 218 740 3.393 500 1730 3.46 21 322 15.30J

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801-538-5357 Date: January 29,2007

by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801-359-3940

Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 500 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.

Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



Well name: 200?-1 QEP FR 7P-36-1 4-19
Operator: Questar Exploration & Production, CO.

String type:  Intermediate

Location: Uintah County

Project ID:
43-047-38992

Design parameters:

Minimum design factors:

Environment:

Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 135 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 500 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 111t
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 2,784 psi
Internal gradient: 0.220 psi/ft Tension: Directional Info - Build & Hold
Calculated BHP 3,720 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 560 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 1001 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 2 °[100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 17.04 °
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings: 5 o
Next sefting depth: 11,738 ft Ny
Tension is based on buoyed weight.  Next mud weight: 8.800 ppg et
Neutral point: 3,844 ft Next setting BHP: 5,366 psi "'Ark? ’\ 4
Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg ® 37 f
Fracture depth: 4256 ft 55
Injection pressure: 4,256 psi
Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) () (ft) (in) (ft°)
1 4400 9.625 40.00 J-55 ST&C 4256 4400 8.75 1873.2
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load  Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design
(psi) {psi) Factor (psi) {psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 1857 2570 1.384 3720 3950 1.06 149 452 3.034
Prepared  Helen Sadik-Macdonald Phone: 801-538-5357 Date: January 29,2007
by: Div of Oil,Gas & Minerals FAX: 801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:

Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 4256 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.
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Well name: 2007-1 QEP FR 7P-36-14-19

Operator: Questar Exploration & Production, CO.

String type:  Production Project ID:
43-047-38992

Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No
Mud weight: 8.800 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 244 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 6,295 ft
Burst
Max anticipated surface
pressure: 2,869 psi
Internal gradient: 0.220 psi/ft Tension: Directional info - Build & Hold
Calculated BHP 5,531 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J) Kick-off point 560 ft
8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J) Departure at shoe: 2514 ft
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J) Maximum dogleg: 2 °1100ft
Premium: 1.50 (J) Inclination at shoe: 0°
Body yield: 1.50 (B)
Tension is based on buoyed weight.
Neutral point: 10,847 #t
Run  Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter  Capacity
(ft) (in) (1bs/ft) () () (in) (ft°)

1 12462 55 17.00 P-110 LT&C 12100 12462 4.767 1626.6
Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension  Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

{psi) (psi) Factor {psi) {psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor

1 5531 7480 1.352 5531 10640 1.92 178 445 2504

Prepared Helen Sadik-Macdonaid
by: Div of Qil,Gas & Minerals

Phone: 801-538-5357
FAX: 801-359-3940

Date: January 29,2007
Salt Lake City, Utah
Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 12100 ft, a mud weight of 8.8 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.
Collapse strength is (biaxially) derated for doglegs in directional wells by multiplying the tensile stress by the cross section area to calculate a

Engineering responsibility for use of this design will be that of the purchaser.



State of Utah

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director
Division of
Oil, Gas & Mining

JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

January 29, 2007

Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
1571 E1700 S
Vemal, UT 84078

Re:  Flat Rock 7P-36-14-19 Well, 1910’ FSL, 162' FWL, NW SW, Sec. 31,
T. 14 South, R. 20 East, Bottom Location 1800' FNL, 1800' FEL. SW NE,
Sec. 36, T. 14 South, R. 19 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-38992.

Sincerely,
Gil Hunt
Associate Director
pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor (via e-mail)
SITLA
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940  TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov



Operator: Questar Exploration & Production, Co.

Well Name & Number Flat Rock 7P-36-14-19

API Number: 43-047-38992

Lease: MIL.-49279

Location: NW SW Sec._31 T. _14 South R. 20 East

Bottom Location: SW NE Sec._36 T. _14 South R. 19 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 ez seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements

The operator is required to notify the Division of Qil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:

¢ 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing

24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment

24 hours prior to spudding the well

within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):
e Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

e Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

(98]

. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit a
complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days
following completion of the well.

W

- Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

&

Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in the
Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)
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January 29, 2007

7. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.

8. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

9. Cement volume for the 5 1/2" production string shall be determined from actual hole
diameter in order to place cement from the pipe setting depth back to 4000' MD as
indicated in the submitted drilling plan.



Form 316-5 UNITED ST ATES R EC E lV FORM APPRUVED

Quae 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 10040135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT FEB 2 8 Expires: March 31, 1993
200 - Lease Designation and Sesial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELL ML-49279
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different res@rly'erF OIL, GAS & M{NING
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals F'T“"“““' Aliotee or Tribe Name
UTE TRIBE
SUB MIT IN TRIPL ICA TE ¥ Unil or CA, Agseement Designation
1.  Typeof Well N/A
oil Gas
D Wel well D Other CBNFIDENT!AL ~Well Name and No.
FR7P361419
2.  Name of Operator
QEP, UINTA BASIN, INC. . AP1Well No.
3. Address and Telephone No. Contact: Dahn.Caldwell@questar.com 43-047-38992
1571 East 1700 South - Vernal, UT 84078 435-781-4342 Fax 435-781-4357 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
A Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R, M., or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED
SURFACE LOCATION: 1910° FSL, 162’ FWL, NWSW, LOT 3, SEC 31-T14S-R20E i1. County or Parish, State
BOTTOM LOCATION: 1800° FNL, 1800’ FEL, SWNE, SEC 36-T14S-R19E UINTAH
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of Intent D Abandonment D Change of Plans
D Recompletion D New Construction
Subsequent Report D Plugging Back D Non-Routine Fracturing
D Casing Repair [:] Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonmeat Notice D Altering Casing D Conversion to Injection
omer  SPUD D Dispose Water

13. DescribeF 4 or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give p inent dates, includi i 4 date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,

P

P 3
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this ‘work)

On 2/5/07 — Drilled 40’ of 26” conductor hole. Run 1 jt 207 conductor pipe. Cmtd w/ Ready Mix.

3 - BLM, 2- Utah OG&M, 1 — Denver, 1 — file Word file-server

pr——  — o ¢ o oo .

14. 1hereby certify that the foregoing is truemnd cofee

signed Dghn F. Caldwell

Office Administator 11 Date 2/23/07

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form )

|

———
(This space for Federa! or State office use)

Approved by: Title

B ——
Date

Conditions of approval, if any

_________________————-——__'__'___7 v ——— e ————————

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or

representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.




-~

State of Utah & uestarf X B/ orati 5% OPERATOR ACCT. No. N5 0 85~

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: HRer
ADDRESS: 1571 East 1700 South
ENTITY ACTION FORM - FORM 6 Vernal, Utah 84078  (435)781-4300
Action | Current | New Entity | API Number Well Name QQ sc | TP | RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No.
No.
99999 _ | 43-047-38992 FR7P 361419 NWSW | 31 | 14S | 20E Uintah 2/05/07
/5954 A/25/07
WELL 1 COMMENTS: BTM LOCATION: SWNE, SEC 36-T14S-R19E \ﬂ.\ N_
WINGT CONFIDE
WELL 2 COMMENTS:
WELL 3 COMMENTS:
WELL 4 COMMENTS:
WELL 5 COMMENTS:
AN N
¢ ACTION CODES (See instructions on back of form) \ |
Y A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) j
B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well) O
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity Signature
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section) Office Administrator |l 2/23/07

Title Date

NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected
Phone No. (435)781-4342

(3/89) RECEIVED
COMFIDEN b 28

DIV OF oL, GRS & MINING
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QuestarE & P Page 1 of 5
Operations Summary Report
Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT 7 3059.38 792 Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cséjdbe Description of Operations
2/8/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 RIG DOWN 60% RIG MOVE 5%
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: WILL LOWER DERRICK THIS MORNING, TOP DRIVE & POWER UNIT
TRUCKED TO GRAND JUNCTION, COLO FOR REPAIRS
2/9/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 RIG DOWN 65% - RIG MOVE 15% (TOTAL 8 HAUL TRUCKS, 2 BED TRUCKS, 2
CRANES, 1 LOADER - BLACKHILLS)
18:00-06:00 |  12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: RIG MOVE 90 MILES ONE WAY, ROAD CONDITIONS BAD
APPROXIMATELY 70 MILES DUE TO THAW. 9 HOURS ROUND TRIP TRUCK.
2/10/2007  {06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 80% RIG DOWN - 20% MOVE (1 TRAILER DOWN BRAKES, 1 TRUCK DOWN
FAN BELT, 1 TRUCK REBUILDING MUD CHAINS) 4 LOADS TODAY
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: 1 MORE HAUL TRUCK THIS AM, 2 GIN TRUCKS TODAY, 1 HAUL TRUCK
TOMORROW
2/11/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 RIG DOWN 95% RIG MOVE 30 % (8 LOADS OFF LOCATION WILL SET
MATTING BOARDS & SUB TODAY ON 7P LOCATION. ESTIMATE MOVE CAMP
TUES. 13TH)
18:00-06:00 | 12.00|{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT (RAIN PM)
- NOTE: 1 TRUCK & TRAILER REPAIRED, 3 MORE TRUCKS ON LOCATION
TODAY
2/12/2007  [06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 RIG DOWN 95% (CAMP LEFT TO RIG DOWN, WILL MOVE TUES 13TH) RIG
MOVE 40% (6 LOADS) RIG UP 5% (SET MATTING BOARDS & LOWER
SUBSTRUCTURE)
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/13/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 RIG DOWN 95% WILL RIG DOWN CAMPS TODAY RIG MOVE 66% 6 BIG LOADS

AND TUBULARS LEFT ON LOCATION, SUB BASE IN PLACE ON 7P, TRUCKS
GETTING STUCK ON MAIN ROAD WILL HAVE BLADES HELP WITH RIG MOVE

TODAY
18:00 - 06:00 12.00LOC 3 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/14/2007 06.00 - 18:00 12.00{ LOC 3 MOVE 5 CAMPS FROM FR 11 TO FR3 RIG MOVE 70%, RIG UP 5%
18:00 - 06:00 12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/15/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00{ LOC 3 RIG UP CAMPS, SET IN DRAWWORKS, FLOOR MOTORS AND TOP DOG
HOUSE, RIG MOVE 75%, RIG UP 10%
18:00 - 06:00 12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/16/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12,00 LOC 3 SET IN SHALE SHAKERS, GAS BUSTER, MUD CLEANER AND #2 PUMP
DERRICK HALF PINNED TOGHETHER, TUBULARS AND MUD, FLARE BOW
AND BOUYE AND FLARE LINES LEFT TO MOVE FROM 11P
18:00 - 06:00 12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/17/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00| LOC 4 RIG 85% MOVED, RIG UP 30%, SET MUD PUMPS AND MUD TANKS FINISH
PINNING DERRICK TOGHETHER
18:00 - 06:00 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/18/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00| LOC 4 PIN IN DERRICK, SET IN SUIT CASES AND OUT BUILDINGS AND REMIANING
SHACKS RIG 90% RIG UP 60%
18:00 - 06:00 12.00( OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/19/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00|LOC 4 HOOK UP AIR, STEAM, WATER AND FUEL LINES SET DEER STANDS RIG UP

75%, RIG MOVE 95% EVERYTHING IS OFF FR11P, WILL WELD WELLHEAD ON
TODAY AND STRING BLOCKS, RAISE DERRICK

2/20/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00|LOC 4 STRING BLOCKS AND RAISE DERRICK, WELD ON WELLHEAD, SET IN AIR
PACKAGE AND MUD, GENERAL RIG UP. WILL SET TOP DRIVE UNIT AND RIG
UP 2/20, NIPPLE UP AND PRESSURE TEST 2/21 DRILL 2/22. RIG MOVE 100%,

RIG UP 80%
18:00 - 06:00 12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/21/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00|LOC 4 BRIDLE DOWN, HYDROMATIC FROZE HAD TO THAW QUT FOR BLOCKS TO

Printed: 3/6/2007 11:06:26 AM

RECEIVED
MAR 0 6 2007

DIV. OF OlL, GAS & MINING



QuestarE& P Page 2 of 5
Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:

Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:dbe Description of Operations

2/21/2007  |06:00-18:00 | t2.00/LOC |4 MOVE, IN STALL TORQUE TUBE AND RIG UP FLOOR, FIRE BOILER AND

CHECK FOR LEAKS, RUN AIR COMPRESSORS, RIG UP 90% WILL FINISH
RIGGING UP TOP DRIVE AND NIPPLE UP 2/21

18:00 - 06:00 12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/22/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00| OTH RIG UP TOP DRIVE
18:00 - 05:00 11.00| BOP 1 NIPPLE UP BOP
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| BOP 2 TEST BOP 250 LOW AND 5000 HUGH, STAND PIPE AND BAG TO 250 LOW
AND 5000 HIGH
2/23/2007 06:00- 11:30 5.50 BOP 2 TEST BOP, LOWER PIPES, BLINDS, UPPER PIPES, KELLY COCK, HCR,

CHOKE MANNIFOLD AND FLOOR VALVES 5000 HIGH AND 250 LOW, STAND
PIPE AND BAG 3500 HIGH AND 250 LOW ALL TESTED OK

11:30 - 12:00 0.50| OTH SET WEAR BUSHING

12:00 - 18:00 6.00/ OTH REFABRICATE BUOYE LINE AND STRING FLARE LINE AND PANIC LINE
18:00 - 19:00 1.00| OTH DRILL AND SET MOUSEHOLE

19:00 - 20:00 1.00{ TRP MAKE UP BHA

20:00 - 20:30 0.50{ RIG REPAIR SERVICE LOOP ON TOP DRIVE

20:30 - 02:00 5.50| TRP PICK UP BHA

CHANGE 10" VALVE ON FLOW LINE

DRILL CEMENT TAG @ 468’ DRILL CEMENT TO 530’

DRILL F/548' TO 680' WOB 15,ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 190
SURVEY @ 655' .6 INC 293.98 AZM

DRILL F/680' TO 1044’ WOB 25, ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6GPM, PP 230
RIG SERVICE

DRILL F/1044' TO 1137° WOB 25, ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 230
SURVEY @ 1129' .8 INC 318.18 AZM

DRILL F/1137" TO 1594' WOB 30, ROT 65, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 255
SURVEY @ 1570' .8 INC 323.38 AZM

DRILL F/1594' TO 1967 WOB 30, ROT 65, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 310

02:00 - 03:00 1.00| RIG

03:00 - 06:00 3.00| DRL
2/24/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00| DRL
08:00 - 08:30 0.50| SUR
08:30 - 14:.00 5.50| DRL
14:00 - 14:30 0.50{ RIG

14:30 - 15:30 1.00} DRL
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| SUR
16:00 - 23:30 7.50| DRL
23:30 - 00:00 0.50| SUR
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| DRL

B m D ada BN N

MAKING VERY LITTLE WATER
2/25/2007 06:00 - 07:45 1.75| DRL 1 DRILL F/1967' TO 2062' WOB 35, ROT 65, AIR 2800 CFM, PP 310 MAKING VERY
LITTLE WATER
07:45 - 08:15 0.50| SUR 1 SURVEY @ 2054' 1.4 INC 350.38 AZM
08:15 - 12:00 3.75| DRL 1 DRILL F/2062' TO 2249' WOB 35, ROT 60, 2800 CFM, 6 GPM, PP 314 WATER
PICKING UP FROM HOLE
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE

-

DRILL F/2249' TO 2457 WOB 35, ROT 60, 2800 CFM, 6 GPM, PP 410 MAKING
WATER

12:30 - 16:00 3.50| DRL

16:00 - 20:00 4.00| TRP 2 TRIP OUT TO PICK UP DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS, LAY DOWN IBS AND BIT SUB
20:00 - 22:.00 2.00| RIG 2 CHANGE ACCUATOR VALVE ON TOP DRIVE
22:00-01:00 3.00{ TRP 1 PICK UP DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS AND ORIENT
01:00 - 04:30 3.50| TRP 2 TRIP iN, TEST MWD AT 650'
04:30 - 05:00 0.50 REAM |1 BREAK CIRCULATION, WASH & REAM LAST STD TO BOTTOM
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 PUMP
2/26/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE CAP GASKET ON #1 PUMP
06:30 - 08:00 1.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/2457' TO 2484’ WOB 35, ROT 25, PS 170, PP 950, AIR 1000, MAKING
VERY LITTLE WATER
08:00 - 09:30 1.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB
09:30- 13:30 4.00| DRL 2 DRILL F/2484' TO 2577' WOB 40, ROT 25, PS 140, PP 850, AIR 1800, LOSING
FLUID, INCREASE AIR AND DECREASE PUMPS SLIDE 12 ROTATE 20°
13:30 - 14:.00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
14:00 - 03:30 13.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 2577' TO
03:30 - 06:00 250 SUR 1 CONNECTION AND SURVEYS
2/27/2007 06:00 - 15:00 9.00| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 3020' TO 3327' WOB 40K, PS 140, PP 850, AIR 1800 (MAINTAINING

Printed: 3/6/2007 11:06:26 AM



QuestarE & P Page 3 of 5
Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code és:(:’e Description of Operations
2/27/2007  |06:00 - 15:00 9.00|DRL |2 VOLUME IN PITS)
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30-03:00 | 1150 DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3327' TO 3975', WOB 40-42K, PS 140, PP 925, AIR 1800 (MAINTAINING
VOLUME IN RESERVE PIT)
03:00 - 06:00 3.00/SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
2/28/2007  {06:00 - 09:00 3.00[DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3975' TO 4083, WOB 42-46K, ROT 40, PS 70, PP 1000, AIR 1800
09:00 - 09:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
09:30 - 14:30 500|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4083' TO 4227', WOB 46-48K, ROT 40, PS 60, PP 800, AIR 1600 (LOST
RETURNS)
14:30 - 15:30 1.00| OTH REGAIN CIRCULATION
15:30 - 16:30 1.00{DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4227' TO 4290, WOB 46-48K, ROT 40, PS 70, PP 1025, AIR 1800
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00 - 18:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE
18:30 - 20:30 200|TRP |15 WIPER TRIP TO 2343' (FIRST 4 STANDS TIGHT, ROTATE & PUMP)
20:30 - 23:00 250/ CIRC |1 ATTEMPT CIRCULATE F/WATER FLOW. GAINED +/- 700 BBL IN RESERVE
23:00 - 01:30 250|TRP |15 WIPER TRIP TO BHA & STAGE IN HOLE
01:30 - 02:30 1.00| REAM {1 WASH & REAM LAST 4 STANDS
02:30 - 03:30 1.00{CIRC {1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE
03:30 - 06:00 250/ TRP |2 TOOH F/ WIRELINE LOGS (SLM)
3/1/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250/ TRP |2 FINISH TOOH F/ LOGS (SLM 4286.82' - 3.18' DIFFERENCE IN TALLY, NO
CHANGE)
08:30 - 09:00 050/TRP |1 LD MWD TOOL & BIT
09:00 - 11:00 200/LOG |1 SAFETY MEETING & R/U SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS
11:00 - 12:30 1.50[LOG |1 RIH TO 1000' W/ RUN # 1, PLATFORM EXPRESS. TOOL FAILURE - GAMMA
RAY
12:30 - 14:00 150|LOG |1 POOH REPAIR TOOL WHILE WAITING OTHER TOOL FROM VERNAL
14:00 - 15:30 150|LOG |1 TEST TOOL, RIH TO 2420', BRIDGED OFF, POOH (LOGGERS FOUND FLUID
LEVEL @ 1235
15:30 - 16:30 1.00[LOG |1 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS
16:30 - 18:30 200|TRP |1 L/D MUD MOTOR, MWD & MONEL. P/U BIT SUB & IBS
18:30 - 20:30 200|TRP |2 TiH TO 2422
20:30 - 22:00 1.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 2422 TO 2680'
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| TRP |2 TIH F/ 2680' TO 3908
23:00 - 01:30 2.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 3908' TO 4290'
01:30 - 02:30 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE
02:30 - 06:00 350|TRP |2 TOOH TO RUN 9-5/8" CASING, L/D 8" DC
- NOTE: NOTIFIED DAN JARVIS W/ UTAH OGM OF INTENT TO RUN CSG &
CEMENT @ 1645 HOURS 2/28/2007
3/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50] OTH LAY DOWN 8" DC & PULL WEAR BUSHING
07:30 - 09:00 1.50/CSG |1 SAFETY MEETING & R/U WEATHERFORD CASING CREW
09:00 - 15:00 6.00/CSG |2 RUN 96 JTS 9-5/8", P110, 47# LT&C CSG, TIGHT @ 3935
15:00 - 16:00 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP & WORK 1 JT CSG THROUGH TIGHT SPOT F/ 3935' TO 3950' (NO
RETURNS)
16:00 - 16:30 050/CSG |2 RUN 3 JTS CSG, TIGHT @ 4120’
16:30 - 20:00 350/ CIRC |1 PUMP & WORK 2 JTS CSG & LANDING JT F/ 4120° TO 4223' (LAST 44 ' NOT
TIGHT) LAND CASING W/ SHOE @ 4267 & FLOAT COLLAR @ 4177' (NO
RETURNS)
20:00 - 00:00 4.00/ OTH INSTALL PACKOFF & PRESSURE TEST W/ 5000 PSI. INSTALL CEMENT
ISOLATION TOOL
00:00 - 01:00 1.00{CMT |1 R/U HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS & HOLD SAFETY MEETING
01:00 - 06:00 500{CMT |2 TEST CMT LINES W/ 5000 PSI, TEST N2 LINES W/ 8000 PSI. PUMP 10 BBL
FRESH WATER, 20 BBL OF FOAMED SUPER FLUSH & 10 BBL FOAMED
WATER. PUMP 180 BBL (688 SKS) FOAMED LEAD CMT W/ 8.5 PPG DENSITY &
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSr;Jdbe Description of Operations
3/2/2007 01:00 - 06:00 5.00|CMT |2 1.47/VIELD. PUMP 35 BBL (134 SKS) FOAMED LEAD CMT W/ 11 PPG DENSITY
& 1.47/VIELD. PUMP 44.9 BBL (172 SKS) TAIL CMT W/ 14.3 PPG DENSITY &
1.47/Y)ELD. DROP PLUG & DISPLACE W/ 308 BBL WATER. BUMP PLUG W/ 800
PSI. FLOAT HELD. NO RETURNS DURING ENTIRE JOB. PUMP 20.7 BBL (75
SKS) CAP CMT W/ 14.6 PPG DENSITY & 1.55/YIELD
3/3/2007 06:00 - 07:30 150/ WOT {1 R/D CEMENTERS - WOC
07:30 - 08:30 1.00{WOT |1 L/D LANDING JT & INSTALL WEAR BUSHING - WOC
08:30 - 11:00 250/ WOT |1 LAY OUT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS - WOC
11:00 - 12:00 100/EQT |1 R/U B&C QUICK TEST & PRESSURE TEST CASING W/ 1500 PSI F/ 30 MIN - OK
12:00 - 18:00 6.00{ RIG 5 THAW STANDPIPE & KELLY HOSE
18:00 - 19:30 150{DRL |3 P/U DIRECTIONAL TOOLS & ORIENT
19:30 - 22:00 250{TRP |2 TIH W/ BIT # 4, TAG CEMENT @ 4172'
22:00 - 23:30 1.50| OTH REPLACE VALVE ON FLOWLINE & REPAIR LEAK
23:30- 01:00 150/ DRL |4 DRILL FLOAT EQUIPMENT, CEMENT POCKET & 10' NEW HOLE TO 4300'
01:00 - 02:30 150 EQT |2 CIRCULATE & FIT W/ 8.5# MUD W/ 682 PSI = EMW 11.50# (PRESSURE
DROPPED F/ 685 TO 682 15 MIN)
02:30 - 05:30 300{DRL |2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/ 4300° TO 4390', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1350.
SLIDE TO BUILD ANGLE
05:30 - 06:00 0.50{ OTH CONNECTION & SURVEYS
3/4/2007 06:00 - 06:30 050|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4390' TO 4395', WOB 12, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1350
06:30 - 07:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT LINER & SWAB # 1 PUMP
07:30 - 16:00 850/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4395' TO 4582, WOB 10, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1200 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO BUILD ANGLE - 6 SLIDES @ 5.2 HRS)
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
17:30 - 19:00 1.50| RIG 2 STANDPIPE HAMMER UNION LEAKING, REPLACE STANDPIPE HAMMER
UNION O-RING
19:00 - 03:00 8.00/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4582' TO 4750, WOB 10, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1250 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO BUILD ANGLE - 5 SLIDES @ 5.4 HRS)
03:00 - 04:00 1.00{ OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|RIG 2 REPLACE MODULE WEAR RING & LINER # 1 PUMP
3/5/2007 06:00 - 06:30 050{DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4750' TO 4770, WOB 10-12, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1300
06:30 - 07:30 1.00| RIG 1 RIG & TOP DRIVE SERVICE
07:30 - 14:00 6.50|{DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4770' TO 4982', WOB 10-12, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 1900 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
14:00 - 15:30 1.50{ OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
15:30 - 16:00 0.50{CIRC |1 MIX & PUMP DRY SLUG
16:00 - 19:30 350 TRP |12 TOOH W/ BIT # 4 (MOTOR WEAK. UNABLE TO SLIDE)
19:30 - 20:30 1.00{ OTH CHANGE OUT MUD MOTOR & BITS
20:30 - 22:00 150|TRP |2 TIH W/ BIT # 5 TO 3900'
22:00 - 23:30 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE
23:30 - 00:30 100/ TRP |2 TIH TO 4875'
00:30 - 01:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM LAST STAND (PRECAUTIONARY)
01:00 - 05:00 400|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4982' TO 5120', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 1980 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/6/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00/DRL |[2 DRILL F/ 5120' TO 5257, WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 2 PASON REPLACED FLOW METER SENSOR BOX
14:30 - 16:30 200/ DRL 2 DRILL F/ 5257" TO 5361’, WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00-04:30 | 1050/ DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5361' TO 5695, WOB 12-14, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
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Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date | From-To | Hours | Code Cs;dbe Description of Operations
362007  |18:00-04:30 | 10.50|DRL |2 |NEEDED TO BULD ANGLE)
0430-06:00 |  1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS

NOTE: WHEN ORIENTATING THE TOOL THE WRONG OFFSET WAS
ENTERED. 31 WAS SCRIBED & 301 SHOULD HAVE BEEN. THIS WAS FOUND 8

HRS AFTER SART DRILLING & READJUSTED.
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Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(February 2005) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Epis. Miarch 31,9007
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT RO
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-56965

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. I Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Typeo 1
Oil Well Gas Well D Other 8. Well Name and NO.
Hoss 26-32
2. Name of Operator
EOG Resources, Inc. 9. APl Well No.
34 Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-38903
600 17th Street, Suite 1000N, Denver, CO 80202 303-824-5526 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

Natural Buttes/Wasatch/Mesaverde
11. County or Parish, State

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec,, T, R, M, or Survey Description)
2007' FNL & 2412' FEL (SWNE)

Sec. 32-T8S-R23E 40.080969 LAT 109350164 LON Ulntah County, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
L] Acidize L] Decpen [ production (StartResume) L) Water Shut-Off
[ Noticeof Intent L] Atter Casing Ol fractre Treat -] Reclamation Well Integrity
D Subsequent Report C] Casing Repair D New Construction D Recomplete Other Commingling
! . (] Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon - ‘ request
[ Final AtendonmentNotice | [ convert to njection L] Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 31604 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, inchuding reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

EOG Resources, Inc. requests permission to commingle the referenced well as indicated by the APD and affidavit submitted 12/4/2006.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining | ofThs
O + Federal Approval
Date: Action |s Necessary

By:

14. Thereby certify thatthe foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Mary A. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant . ~. A_LQ’E : !
S | ot -
ware [\ 1) a‘\ﬂ/\m.\lm._ Date 3200

THIS SPACE ;*OR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Title Date

Approvedty _ e
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease | office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 and Titled3 U.S.C. Section 1212, make ita crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations & to anymatter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)



QuestarE & P Page 1 of 10

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 9/ 9/ . Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT 3‘0 ? 3 g 7 7;“ Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs;dbe Description of Operations
2/8/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 RIG DOWN 60% RIG MOVE 5%
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: WILL LOWER DERRICK THIS MORNING, TOP DRIVE & POWER UNIT
TRUCKED TO GRAND JUNCTION, COLO FOR REPAIRS
2/9/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 RIG DOWN 65% - RIG MOVE 15% (TOTAL 8 HAUL TRUCKS, 2 BED TRUCKS, 2
CRANES, 1 LOADER - BLACKHILLS)
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: RIG MOVE 80 MILES ONE WAY, ROAD CONDITIONS BAD
APPROXIMATELY 70 MILES DUE TO THAW. 9 HOURS ROUND TRIP TRUCK.
2/10/2007  {06:00- 18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 80% RIG DOWN - 20% MOVE (1 TRAILER DOWN BRAKES, 1 TRUCK DOWN
FAN BELT, 1 TRUCK REBUILDING MUD CHAINS) 4 LOADS TODAY
18:00- 06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: 1 MORE HAUL TRUCK THIS AM, 2 GIN TRUCKS TODAY, 1 HAUL TRUCK
TOMORROW
2/11/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 RIG DOWN 95% RIG MOVE 30 % (8 LOADS OFF LOCATION WILL SET
MATTING BOARDS & SUB TODAY ON 7P LOCATION. ESTIMATE MOVE CAMP
TUES. 13TH)
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT (RAIN PM)
- NOTE: 1 TRUCK & TRAILER REPAIRED, 3 MORE TRUCKS ON LOCATION
TODAY
2/12/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 RIG DOWN 95% (CAMP LEFT TO RIG DOWN, WiLL MOVE TUES 13TH) RIG
MOVE 40% (6 LOADS) RIG UP 5% (SET MATTING BOARDS & LOWER
SUBSTRUCTURE)
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/13/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 RIG DOWN 95% WILL RIG DOWN CAMPS TODAY RIG MOVE 65% 6 BIG LOADS
AND TUBULARS LEFT ON LOCATION, SUB BASE IN PLACE ON 7P, TRUCKS
GETTING STUCK ON MAIN ROAD WILL HAVE BLADES HELP WITH RIG MOVE
TODAY
18:00-06:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/14/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC (3 MOVE 5 CAMPS FROM FR 11 TO FR3 RIG MOVE 70%, RIG UP 5%
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/15/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 RIG UP CAMPS, SET IN DRAWWORKS, FLOOR MOTORS AND TOP DOG
HOUSE, RIG MOVE 75%, RIG UP 10%
18:00-06:00 |  12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/16/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |3 SET IN SHALE SHAKERS, GAS BUSTER, MUD CLEANER AND #2 PUMP
DERRICK HALF PINNED TOGHETHER, TUBULARS AND MUD, FLARE BOW
AND BOUYE AND FLARE LINES LEFT TO MOVE FROM 11P
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/117/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 RIG 85% MOVED, RIG UP 30%, SET MUD PUMPS AND MUD TANKS FINISH
PINNING DERRICK TOGHETHER
18:00-06:00 | 12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/18/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 PIN IN DERRICK, SET IN SUIT CASES AND OUT BUILDINGS AND REMIANING
SHACKS RIG 90% RIG UP 60%
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/19/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00]/LOC |4 HOOK UP AIR, STEAM, WATER AND FUEL LINES SET DEER STANDS RIG UP
75%, RIG MOVE 95% EVERYTHING IS OFF FR11P, WILL WELD WELLHEAD ON
TODAY AND STRING BLOCKS, RAISE DERRICK
2/20/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC {4 STRING BLOCKS AND RAISE DERRICK, WELD ON WELLHEAD, SET IN AIR
PACKAGE AND MUD, GENERAL RIG UP. WILL SET TOP DRIVE UNIT AND RIG
UP 2/20, NIPPLE UP AND PRESSURE TEST 2/21 DRILL 2/22. RIG MOVE 100%,
RIG UP 80%
18:00- 06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/21/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 BRIDLE DOWN, HYDROMATIC FROZE HAD TO THAW OUT FOR BLOCKS TO

Printed: 4/5/2007 8:20:04 AM

RECEIVED
APR 05 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING




QuestarE & P Page 2 of 10
Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
2/21/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 MOVE, IN STALL TORQUE TUBE AND RIG UP FLOOR, FIRE BOILER AND
i CHECK FOR LEAKS, RUN AIR COMPRESSORS, RIG UP 90% WILL FINISH
RIGGING UP TOP DRIVE AND NIPPLE UP 2/21
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/22/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00| OTH RIG UP TOP DRIVE
18:00-05:00 | 11.00|BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOP
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{BOP |2 TEST BOP 250 LOW AND 5000 HUGH, STAND PIPE AND BAG TO 250 LOW
AND 5000 HIGH
2/23/2007  {06:00 - 11:30 550{BOP |2 TEST BOP, LOWER PIPES, BLINDS, UPPER PIPES, KELLY COCK, HCR,
CHOKE MANNIFOLD AND FLOOR VALVES 5000 HIGH AND 250 LOW, STAND
: PIPE AND BAG 3500 HIGH AND 250 LOW ALL TESTED OK
11:30 - 12:00 0.50{ OTH SET WEAR BUSHING
12:00 - 18:00 6.00{ OTH REFABRICATE BUOYE LINE AND STRING FLARE LINE AND PANIC LINE
18:00 - 19:00 1.00{ OTH DRILL AND SET MOUSEHOLE
19:00 - 20:00 1.00|TRP |1 MAKE UP BHA
20:00 - 20:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR SERVICE LOOP ON TOP DRIVE
20:30 - 02:00 550/ TRP |1 PICK UP BHA
02:00 - 03:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE 10" VALVE ON FLOW LINE
03:00 - 06:00 300{DRL |4 DRILL CEMENT TAG @ 468' DRILL CEMENT TO 530'
2/24/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 2.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/548' TO 680' WOB 15,ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 190
08:00 - 08:30 0.50[SUR |1 SURVEY @ 655' .6 INC 293.98 AZM
08:30 - 14:00 5.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/680' TO 1044' WOB 25, ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6GPM, PP 230
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
14:30 - 15:30 100/{DRL |1 DRILL F/1044' TO 1137 WOB 25, ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 230
15:30 - 16:00 0.50|SUR |1 SURVEY @ 1129' .8 INC 318.18 AZM
16:00 - 23:30 750{DRL |1 DRILL F/1137' TO 1594' WOB 30, ROT 65, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 255
23:30 - 00:00 0.50|SUR |1 SURVEY @ 1570' .8 INC 323.38 AZM
00:00 - 06:00 6.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/1594' TO 1967' WOB 30, ROT 65, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 310
MAKING VERY LITTLE WATER
2/25/2007  |06:00 - 07:45 175|DRL |1 DRILL F/1967 TO 2062' WOB 35, ROT 65, AIR 2800 CFM, PP 310 MAKING VERY
LITTLE WATER
07:45- 08:15 050/ SUR |1 SURVEY @ 2054’ 1.4 INC 350.38 AZM
08:15 - 12:00 3.75/DRL |1 DRILL F/2062' TO 2249' WOB 35, ROT 60, 2800 CFM, 6 GPM, PP 314 WATER
PICKING UP FROM HOLE
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:30 - 16:00 350(DRL |1 DRILL F/2249' TO 2457 WOB 35, ROT 60, 2800 CFM, 6 GPM, PP 410 MAKING
WATER
16:00 - 20:00 4.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO PICK UP DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS, LAY DOWN IBS AND BIT SUB
20:00 - 22:00 2.00| RIG 2 CHANGE ACCUATOR VALVE ON TOP DRIVE
22:00 - 01:00 3.00[TRP |1 PICK UP DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS AND ORIENT
01:00 - 04:30 350|TRP |2 TRIP IN, TEST MWD AT 650°
04:30 - 05:00 0.50| REAM |1 BREAK CIRCULATION, WASH & REAM LAST STD TO BOTTOM
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 PUMP
2/26/2007  |06:00 - 06:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE CAP GASKET ON #1 PUMP
06:30 - 08:00 150/ DRL |2 DRILL F/2457' TO 2484' WOB 35, ROT 25, PS 170, PP 950, AIR 1000, MAKING
VERY LITTLE WATER
08:00 - 09:30 1.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB
09:30 - 13:30 400{DRL |2 DRILL F/2484' TO 2577' WOB 40, ROT 25, PS 140, PP 850, AIR 1800, LOSING
FLUID, INCREASE AIR AND DECREASE PUMPS SLIDE 12' ROTATE 20'
13:30 - 14:00 0.50{ RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
14:00-03:30 | 13.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 2577* TO
03:30 - 06:00 250[SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEYS
2/27/2007 | 06:00 - 15:00 9.00/|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3020' TO 3327' WOB 40K, PS 140, PP 850, AIR 1800 (MAINTAINING
3
l
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS(‘;Jdbe Description of Operations
2/27/2007  |06:00 - 15:00 9.00|DRL |2 VOLUME IN PITS)
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30-03:00 | 11.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3327' TO 3975', WOB 40-42K, PS 140, PP 925, AIR 1800 (MAINTAINING
VOLUME IN RESERVE PIT)
03:00 - 06:00 3.00|SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
2/28/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 300|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3975' TO 4083, WOB 42-46K, ROT 40, PS 70, PP 1000, AIR 1800
09:00 - 09:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
09:30 - 14:30 500{DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4083 TO 4227", WOB 46-48K, ROT 40, PS 60, PP 800, AIR 1600 (LOST
RETURNS)
14:30 - 15:30 1.00| OTH REGAIN CIRCULATION
15:30 - 16:30 1.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4227 TO 4290', WOB 46-48K, ROT 40, PS 70, PP 1025, AIR 1800
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00 - 18:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE
18:30 - 20:30 200{TRP 15  [WIPER TRIP TO 2343 (FIRST 4 STANDS TIGHT, ROTATE & PUMP)
20:30 - 23:00 250|CIRC |1 ATTEMPT CIRCULATE FAWATER FLOW. GAINED +/- 700 BBL IN RESERVE
23:00 - 01:30 250/ TRP |15  |WIPER TRIP TO BHA & STAGE IN HOLE
01:30 - 02:30 1.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM LAST 4 STANDS
02:30 - 03:30 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE
03:30 - 06:00 250/ TRP |2 TOOH F/ WIRELINE LOGS (SLM)
3/1/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250|TRP |2 FINISH TOOH F/ LOGS (SLM 4286.82' - 3.18' DIFFERENCE IN TALLY, NO
CHANGE)
08:30 - 09:00 050/ TRP |1 L/D MWD TOOL & BIT
00:00 - 11:00 2.00/LOG |1 SAFETY MEETING & R/U SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS
11:00 - 12:30 150/LOG |1 RIH TO 1000' W/ RUN # 1, PLATFORM EXPRESS. TOOL FAILURE - GAMMA
RAY
12:30 - 14:00 1.50(LOG |1 POOH REPAIR TOOL WHILE WAITING OTHER TOOL FROM VERNAL
14:00 - 15:30 150(L0G |1 TEST TOOL, RiH TO 2420', BRIDGED OFF, POOH (LOGGERS FOUND FLUID
LEVEL @ 1235
15:30 - 16:30 1.00/LOG |1 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS
16:30 - 18:30 200, TRP |1 L/D MUD MOTOR, MWD & MONEL. P/U BIT SUB & IBS
18:30 - 20:30 200{TRP |2 TIH TO 2422’
20:30 - 22:00 1.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 2422' TO 2680'
22:00 - 23:00 1.00|TRP |2 TIH F/ 2680' TO 3908
23:00 - 01:30 2.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 3908' TO 4290'
01:30 - 02:30 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE
02:30 - 06:00 350/ TRP |2 TOOH TO RUN 9-5/8" CASING, L/D 8" DC
- NOTE: NOTIFIED DAN JARVIS W/ UTAH OGM OF INTENT TO RUN CSG &
CEMENT @ 1645 HOURS 2/28/2007
3/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| OTH LAY DOWN 8" DC & PULL WEAR BUSHING
07:30 - 09:00 1.50|CSG |1 SAFETY MEETING & R/U WEATHERFORD CASING CREW
09:00 - 15:00 6.00/CSG |2 RUN 96 JTS 9-5/8", P110, 47# LT&C CSG, TIGHT @ 3935
15:00 - 16:00 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP & WORK 1 JT CSG THROUGH TIGHT SPOT F/ 3935' TO 3950' (NO
RETURNS)
16:00 - 16:30 050/CSG |2 RUN 3 JTS CSG, TIGHT @ 4120'
16:30 - 20:00 3.50|CIRC |1 PUMP & WORK 2 JTS CSG & LANDING JT F/ 4120' TO 4223 (LAST 44 ' NOT
TIGHT) LAND CASING W/ SHOE @ 4267' & FLOAT COLLAR @ 4177' (NO
RETURNS)
20:00 - 00:00 4.00| OTH INSTALL PACKOFF & PRESSURE TEST W/ 5000 PSI. INSTALL CEMENT
ISOLATION TOOL
00:00 - 01:00 1.00|CMT |1 R/U HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS & HOLD SAFETY MEETING
01:00 - 06:00 5.00/CMT |2 TEST CMT LINES W/ 5000 PSI, TEST N2 LINES W/ 8000 PSI. PUMP 10 BBL

FRESH WATER, 20 BBL OF FOAMED SUPER FLUSH & 10 BBL FOAMED
WATER. PUMP 180 BBL (688 SKS) FOAMED LEAD CMT W/ 8.5 PPG DENSITY &
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:

Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code (;S:dbe Description of Operations

3/2/2007 01:00 - 06:00 5.00{CMT |2 1.47/YIELD. PUMP 35 BBL (134 SKS) FOAMED LEAD CMT W/ 11 PPG DENSITY

& 1.47/YIELD. PUMP 44.9 BBL (172 SKS) TAIL CMT W/ 14.3 PPG DENSITY &
1.47/YIELD. DROP PLUG & DISPLACE W/ 308 BBL WATER. BUMP PLUG W/ 800
PSI. FLOAT HELD. NO RETURNS DURING ENTIRE JOB. PUMP 20.7 BBL (75
SKS) CAP CMT W/ 14.6 PPG DENSITY & 1.55/YIELD

3/3/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| WOT 1 R/D CEMENTERS - WOC
07:30 - 08:30 1.00| WOT 1 L/D LANDING JT & INSTALL WEAR BUSHING - WOC
08:30 - 11.00 2.50| WOT 1 LAY OUT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS - WOC
11:00 - 12:00 1.00| EQT 1 R/U B&C QUICK TEST & PRESSURE TEST CASING W/ 1500 PSi F/ 30 MIN - OK
12:00 - 18:00 6.00| RIG 5 THAW STANDPIPE & KELLY HOSE
18:00 - 19:30 1.50| DRL 3 P/U DIRECTIONAL TOOLS & ORIENT
19:30 - 22:.00 2.50| TRP 2 TIH W/ BIT # 4, TAG CEMENT @ 4172
22:00-23:30 1.50| OTH REPLACE VALVE ON FLOWLINE & REPAIR LEAK
23:30-01:00 1.50| DRL 4 DRILL FLOAT EQUIPMENT, CEMENT POCKET & 10' NEW HOLE TO 4300
01:00- 02:30 150 EQT 2 CIRCULATE & FIT W/ 8.5# MUD W/ 682 PSI = EMW 11.58# (PRESSURE
DROPPED F/ 685 TO 682 15 MIN)
02:30 - 05:30 3.00| DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/ 4300' TO 4390", WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1350.
SLIDE TO BUILD ANGLE
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| OTH CONNECTION & SURVEYS
3/4/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 4390' TO 4395', WOB 12, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1350
06:30 - 07:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT LINER & SWAB # 1 PUMP
07:30 - 16:00 8.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 4395 TO 4582, WOB 10, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1200 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO BUILD ANGLE - 6 SLIDES @ 5.2 HRS)
16:00 - 17:00 1.00; OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
17:00- 17:30 0.50{ RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
17:30 - 12:00 1.50{ RIG 2 STANDPIPE HAMMER UNION LEAKING, REPLACE STANDPIPE HAMMER
UNION O-RING
19:00 - 03.00 8.00| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 4582' TO 4750', WOB 10, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1250 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO BUILD ANGLE - 5 SLIDES @ 5.4 HRS)
03.00 - 04:00 1.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|RIG 2 REPLACE MODULE WEAR RING & LINER # 1 PUMP
3/5/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50| DRL 2 DRILL £/ 4750' TO 4770', WOB 10-12, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1300
06:30 - 07:30 1.00| RIG 1 RIG & TOP DRIVE SERVICE
07:30 - 14:00 6.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 4770' TO 4982', WOB 10-12, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 1900 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
14:00 - 15:30 150 OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| CIRC 1 MiX & PUMP DRY SLUG
16:00 - 19:30 3.50| TRP 12 TOOH W/ BIT # 4 (MOTOR WEAK. UNABLE TO SLIDE)
19:30 - 20:30 1.00| OTH CHANGE OUT MUD MOTOR & BITS

20:30 - 22:00 1.50| TRP 2 TIH W/ BIT # 5 TO 3900'

22:00 -23:30 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE

23:30-00:30 1.00| TRP 2 TIH TO 4875'

00:30 - 01:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM LAST STAND (PRECAUTIONARY)

01:00 - 05:00 4.00, DRL 2 DRILL F/ 4982 TO 5120, WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 1980 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)

05:00 - 06:00 1.00{ OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/6/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 5120° TO 5257', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
14:.00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 2 PASON REPLACED FLOW METER SENSOR BOX
14:30 - 16:30 2.00| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 5257' TO 5361, WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00 - 04:30 10.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 5361 TO 5695', WOB 12-14, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:dbe Description of Operations
3/6/2007 18:00-04:30 | 10.50|DRL |2 NEEDED TO BULD ANGLE)
04:30 - 06:00 1.50{ OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
- NOTE: WHEN ORIENTATING THE TOOL THE WRONG OFFSET WAS
ENTERED. 31 WAS SCRIBED & 301 SHOULD HAVE BEEN. THIS WAS FOUND 8
HRS AFTER SART DRILLING & READJUSTED.
3/7/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT LINER & SWAB # 1 PUMP
07:00 - 14:30 750|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5695' TO 5892', WOB 12-14, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2100 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO HOLD ANGLE)
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:00 - 17:00 200{DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5892' TO 5985', WOB 12-14, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2100 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO HOLD ANGLE)
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00-04:30 | 1050/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5985' TO 6297, WOB 14-18, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2150
04:30 - 06:00 1.50{ OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
- NOTE: 10-12 OZ METAL ON DITCH MAGNET
3/8/2007 06:00 - 13:30 750|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6297 TO 6421, WOB 8-12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2050 (ROTATE W/
REDUCED ROP & ATTEMPT TO HELP BUILD ANGLE)
13:30 - 14:30 1.00{ OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
14:30 - 15:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & PUMP DRY SLUG
15:00 - 19:00 400 TRP |10 TOOH W/ BIT #5
19:00 - 20:00 1.00|TRP |2 CHANGE BITS, REDIAL MOTOR TO 1.83, CHANGE BATTERIES & ORIENT MWD
20:00 - 22:00 2.00|TRP |10 TIH W/ BIT #6 TO SHOE
22:00 - 06:00 8.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE (TESCO POWER UNIT ENGINE LEAKING OIL INTO RADIATOR)
WAIT ON OIL COOLER FROM GRAND JUNCTION
3/9/2007 06:00 - 14:30 8.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AT SHOE, TESCO WAITING ON OiL COOLER FOR POWER UNIT
14:30 - 18:30 400/ CIRC {1 CIRCULATE, INSTALL NEW OIL COOLER & FLUSH RADIATOR 4 TIMES
18:30 - 01:00 650/ TRP |2 RIG DOWN CIRCULATING HOSE & TIH F/ 3990’ TOTAL 16 STDS, WASH &
REAM F/ 4652 TO 4736' - 4842 TO 5202 - 5890' TO 6168’ & 6360' TO 6421'
TOTAL 9 STDS
01:00 - 05:30 450|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6421' TO 6514', WOB 12-14, ROT 20, PS 90, PP 2000
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| OTH CONNECTION & SURVEYS
3/10/2007  |06:00 - 08:00 200|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6514' TO 6544, WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1800
08:00 - 08:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
08:30 - 17:30 9.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6544’ TO 6648', WOB 14-16, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1850
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00 - 02:00 8.00/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6648' TO 6731', WOB 18-22, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1850
02:00 - 03:30 1.50| RIG 2 RETRIEVE DP SCREEN
03:30 - 04:00 0.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6731' TO 6739' WOB 22, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1850
04:00 - 04:30 0.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
04:30 - 05:00 0.50|CIRC |1 MIX & PUMP DRY SLUG
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| TRP |10 TOOH W/ BIT #6
3/11/2007 | 06:00 - 11:30 550/ TRP |2 TOOH W/BIT # 6
11:30 - 13:00 150|TRP |2 CHANGE OUT BIT & MUD MOTOR, ORIENT MWD (MOTOR 1.5 BEND)
13:00 - 21:00 8.00{TRP |2 TIH W/ BIT # 7 TO 2920 (TOOH 13 STANDS TO RETRIEVE DP SCREEN) TIH TO
4393, WASH & REAM F/ 4393 TO 4399, 4645' TO 4652', 4921’ TO 4955', 5024'
TO 5044', 5099' TO 5105', 5121' TO 5143', 5368' TO 5402', 5765' TO 5794', 5894’
TO 5984'
21:00 - 22:00 1.00{CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN
22:00 - 23:30 150/ TRP |2 TIH F/ 5984’ TO 6739' (WASH & REAM)
23:30 - 01:30 2.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6739 TO 6827", WOB 16, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1900
- OTH DAYLIGHT SAVINGS TIME
02:30 - 06:00 350[DRL 2 DRILL F/ 6827 TO 6910, WOB 16, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1900
3/12/2007 | 06:00 - 12:30 6.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/6910' TO 7014', WOB 14, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1800 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs;dbe Description of Operations
3/12/2007  |06:00 - 12:30 650/DRL |2 TO HOLD ANGLE)
12:30 - 13:30 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, CHANGE OIL IN SWIVEL
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE VALVE CAP GASKETS # 1 PUMP
14:00 - 21:30 750/ DRL |2 DRILL F/ 7014' TO 7264', WOB 16, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1850 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO HOLD ANGLE)
21:30 - 22:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE LINER GASKET # 1 PUMP
22:00 - 03:30 550{DRL |2 DRILL F/ 7264' TO 7449', WOB 16, ROT 20 PS 150, PP 1900 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO HOLD ANGLE
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE POPOFF VALVE # 1 PUMP
04:00 - 06:00 2.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/13/2007  |06:00 - 09:30 350/DRL |2 DRILL F/7449' TO 7556' WOB 16, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2100 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB ON #1 PUMP
10:00 - 10:30 050/ DRL |2 DRILL F/7556' TO 7575' WOB 16, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2100
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| RIG 1 'RIG SERVICE
11:00-22:00 | 11.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/7575' TO 7797' WOB 17, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2200 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE UNABLE TO SLIDE WEIGHT DROPPING ON BIT STALLING MOTOR
22:00 - 23:00 1.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND MIX DRY PIPE PILL
23:00 - 03:00 400{TRP |10 TRIP OUT BIT #7 TIGHT OFF BOTTOM 70000 OVERPULL
03:00 - 04:00 1.00|TRP |1 PICK UP TRICONE BIT #8 AND SET MOTOR @ 1.83

04:00 - 06:00 2.00| TRP 10 TRIP IN WITH BIT #8 PULSE TEST
3/14/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00| TRP 10 TRIP INBIT #8

08:00 - 10:30 2.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM 7574' TO 7797"
10:30 - 04.00 17.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/7797" TO 8025' WOB 45, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2150 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE RUNNING 10 GPM TO BUILD VOLUME LOSING 15 GPM
04:00 - 06:00 2.00| SUR 1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY
3/15/2007 06:00 - 1300 7.00| DRL 1 DRILL F/ 8025' T/ 8131', MW-9.3, VIS-42, WOB-45, ROT-25, PS-188, PP-2300,
SLIDE TO MAINTAIN ANGLE,
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| DRL 1 SERVICE RIG
13:30-17:00 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL F/8131' T/8204'
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP
18:00 - 04:00 10.00( DRL 1 DRILL F/8204' T/ 8413'
04:00 - 06:00 2.00; SUR 1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/16/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50|{ DRL 1 DRILL F/ 8413 T/ 8504', WOB-45, RPM 130, PS- 185, PP- 2300PSI, MW-9.3,
Vis-42
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE & TOP DRIVE
12:00 - 13:00 1.00| SUR 1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
13:00 - 19:00 6.00| DRL 1 DRILL F/ 8504 T/ 8590
19:00 - 22:00 3.00| TRP 10 POOH
22:00 - 06:00 8.00| ISP 1 INSPECT BHA 45 JTS HWDP, 6 COLLARS
3/17/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| ISP 1 INSPECT BHA
07:30-08:30 1.00| TRP 1 P/ MUD MOTOR, CROSS OVER SUB
08:30 - 09:30 1.00{ TRP 2 TIH, MWD NOT SENDING SIGNAL
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| TRP 13 TRIP OUT TO CHECK MWD COMMUNICATION
10:00 - 13:30 3.50| DRL 3 MWD FAILURE, TOOL IS NOT RECIEVING DOWN LOAD, TRYING ANOTHER
TOOL
13:30-17:30 4.00{ TRP 2 TIH, TIGHT SPOT @ 4804’
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/4804' T/ 4907
18:00 - 20:00 2.00|TRP 2 TIH BIT #9
20:00 - 21:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 8519, T/8590'
21.00 - 22:30 1.50| DRL 1 DRILL F/8590' T/8600', MW-9.4, VIS- 42, STKS- 168, PP- 1890PSI, WOB 12K,
ROT 30 RPM,
22:30 - 23:30 1.00; DRL 2 ATTEMPT TO SLIDE F/8600' MADE 2 FT, SURVEY
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
3/17/2007  |23:30 - 00:00 0.50/DRL |1 DRILL F/8602 T/8612'
00:00 - 03:30 350/DRL |2 SLIDE F/8612' T/ 8624 PUMPED SWEEP TO HELP SLIDE
03:30 - 06:00 250{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8624 T/8665
3/18/2007  |06:00 - 12:30 6.50/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8665' T/ 8758', MW- 9.3, VIS-41, WOB-24K, ROP-22FT/HR, STKS-177,
PP- 1870 PSI, ROTARY-32,
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, REPLACE VALVE IN # 1 MUD PUMP
113:00 - 22:00 9.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/8758' T/8943
22:00 - 00:00 200[SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
100:00 - 06:00 6.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/8943 T/9073'
3/19/2007 ;0600 - 11:00 5.00(DRL |1 DRILL F/ 9073' T/ 9250', MW-9.4, VIS- 42, PP- 2200PSI, STKS- 189,
: ROP-45FT/HR, 20K WOB, ROT-35 RPM,
:11:00 - 12:00 1.00[SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS, SURVEY EVERY 30'
[12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
112:30 - 13:30 1.00| OTH REMOVE & REPLACE 1 VALVE TO HELP SLIDE
i13:30-01:00 | 11.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/9250' T/ 9530 , SLIDE TO MAINTAIN ANGLE
101:00 - 02:00 1.00| OTH REMOVE & REPLACE 1 VALVE TO HELP SLIDE
102:00 - 05:00 3.00[DRL |2 DRILL F/9530 T/ 9595 SLIDING TO MAINTAIN ANGLE
105:00 - 06:00 1.00{SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/20/2007  |06:00 - 12:30 650{DRL |2 DRILL F/9595' TO 9781' WOB 12, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2350 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE SLIDING 2 HOURS WANTING DROP ANGLE TO FAST
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:00 - 16:30 350/DRL |2 DRILL F/9781' TO 9982' WOB 12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
16:30 - 17:30 1.00{SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY TIME
17:30 - 18:00 0.50/ OTH CRIPPLE PUMP
18:00 - 02:00 800/DRL |2 DRILL F/9982' TO 10189' WOB 12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
02:00 - 03:30 1.50| RIG 2 REPLACE PUMP ROD #2 PUMP
03:30 - 04:00 050/DRL |2 DRILL F/10189' TO 10217' WOB 12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
04:00 - 05:00 1.00{SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|DRL |2 SLIDING F/10217' TO 10221'
3/21/2007  [06:00 - 06:30 0.50[CIRC |1 PUMP PILL
06:30 - 12:30 6.00| TRP |10 TRIP QUT BIT #9 HIGH DRAG OFF BOTTOM PULLING 120 OVER
12:30 - 15:00 250[TRP |10 TRIP IN BIT #10 TO SHOE CHANGE BHA PICK UP DRILL COLLARS
15:00 - 16:00 1.00| RIG 6 SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE
18:00 - 18:00 200|TRP |10 TRIP IN TO 7700' SWIVEL PACKING LEAKING
18:00 - 19:30 1.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWIVEL PACKING
19:30 - 21:30 200/TRP {10 TRIP IN FILL PIPE SWIVEL PACKING LEAKING
21:30 - 00:00 2.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWIVEL PACKING
00:00 - 05:00 5.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 9920’ TO 10219’ DUE TO HIGH TORQUE BOTTOMS
UP FLARE 30'
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{DRL (2 DRILL F/10219' TO 10239 WOB 20, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2400
3/22/2007  |06:00 - 15:00 9.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/10239' TO 10411 WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550 SLIDE TO DROP
ANGLE
1500 - 15:30 0.50| OTH WORK TORQUE OUT IN HOLE
15:30 - 16:00 0.50/DRL |2 DRILL F/10411' TO 10433' WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550
16:00 - 16:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 17:00 0.50/DRL |2 DRILL F/10433' TO 10452' WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550
17:00 - 18:00 100{SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY TIME
18:00-04:30 | 10.50{DRL |2 DRILL F/10452' TO 10746' WOB 30, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550 SLIDE TO DROP
ANGLE AND MAINTAIN AZM
04:30 - 06:00 150/SUR |1 CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS
3/23/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 500{DRL |2 DRILL F/10746' TO 10807 WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2650 SLIDE TO DROP
ANGLE
11:00 - 11:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
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Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csc;ﬁ)e Description of Operations
3/23/2007  |11:30 - 12:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE SWAB ROD ON #2 PUMP
12:00 - 17:00 500/DRL |2 DRILL F/10807" TO 10867' WOB 35, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2650 LAST SURVEY
HAD .63 INC
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB ON #1 PUMP
17:30 - 18:00 0.50[SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY
18:00 - 20:30 2.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/10867" TO 10878' WOB 15, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2650 FRACTURED AND
HIGH TORQUE
20:30 - 21:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE
21:00 - 05:00 800/ TRP |10 TRIP OUT BIT #10 BACK REAM FIRST 12 STDS
05:00 - 06:00 1.00( TRP LAY DOWN DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS
3/24/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 100/ TRP |1 LAY DOWN DIRRECTION TOOLS
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
07:30 - 12:30 5.00|BOP |2 TEST BOP, FLOOR VALVES, RAMS AND CHOKE TO 250 LOW AND 5000 HIGH,
BAG AND STAND PIPE TO 250 LOW AND 3500 HIGH
12:30 - 18:00 5.50 TRIP IN WITH BIT #11
18:00 - 18:30 0.50| REAM 1 WASH AND REAM 2 STDS TO BOTTOM, NO ROTATION DUE TO STALLING
TOP DRIVE
18:30 - 21:30 300{DRL |1 DRILL F/10878' TO 10889' COULD NOT ROTATE, STALLING TOP DRIVE TRY
TO SLIDE AHEAD WEIGHT HANGING UP ON WALL
21:30 - 23:00 1.50| TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO LAY DOWN DC, BACK REAM FIRST 10 STDS OUT
23:00 - 23:30 0.50| CIRC |1 PUMP DRY PIPE PILL
23:30 - 06:00 8.50| TRP |2 TRIP OUT
3/25/2007 | 06:00 - 11:00 5.00[TRP |10 TRIP IN BIT #12 ONE DRILL COLLAR IN STRING
11:00 - 12:00 1.00{ REAM |1 WASH AND REAM LAST 3 STDS TO BOTTOM HIGH TORQUE
12:00 - 15:00 3.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/10889' TO 10943' WOB 45, ROT 45, PS 180, PP 2300 TORQUE
DECREASING
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30-06:00 | 1450/ DRL |1 DRILL F/10943' TO 11078' WOB 45, ROT 45, PS 190, PP 2350
3/26/2007 | 06:00 - 06:30 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/11078' TO 11095' WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 190, PP 2350
06:30 - 07:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
07:00 - 14:00 7.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/11095' TO 11155’ WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2350
14:00 - 14:30 0.50|SUR |1 DROP SURVEY
14:30 - 22:00 750/ TRP |10 TRIP OUT BIT #12 BACK REAM FIRST FOUR STANDS
22:00 - 00:30 250/ TRP |10 TRIP IN BIT #13 TO 5400'
00:30 - 02:00 1.50| RIG 2 #2 PUMP CLUTCH HABGING UP CHANGE QUICK RELEASE
02:00 - 04:30 250[TRP |10 FINISH TRIP IN
04:30 - 05:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM LAST 2 STDS TO BOTTOM
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/11155' TO 11162' WOB 45, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
3/27/2007 | 06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11155 TO 11190", WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
10:30 - 11:00 0.50, RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
11:00 - 12:00 1.00/{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11190' TO 11195', WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE PUMP ROD & SWAB # 1 MUD PUMP
12:30 - 18:30 6.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11195' TO 11244', WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
18:30 - 19:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB # 1 PUMP
19:30 - 20:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11244’ TO 11246', WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
20:00 - 21:00 1.00/SUR |1 DROP SURVEY
21:00 - 22:00 1.00|TRP (10 TOOH W/ BIT # 13, ROTATE & PUMP FIRST 2 STANDS, PUMP DRY SLUG
22:00 - 23:00 1.00|RIG 2 CHANGE OUT PIPE SPINNERS
23:00 - 03:30 450/TRP |10 FINISH TOOH
03:30 - 06:00 250/ TRP |10 TIH W/ BIT # 14
3/28/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 6 CUT DRILL LINE
07:00 - 09:30 250/ TRP 10 TIH TO 11190'
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM TO 11246', PUMP SWEEP & CLEAN BOTTOM

Printed: 4/5/2007 8:20:04 AM




QuestarE & P Page 9 of 10
Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
3/28/2007  |10:30 - 16:30 6.00 DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11246' TO11306', WOB 22-26, ROT 30, PS 90, PP 2350 (HIGH TORQUE,
STALLING TOP DRIVE & MUD MOTOR)
16:30 - 17:30 1.00[SUR |1 CIRCULATE & DROP SURVEY
17:30 - 18:30 100/ TRP |12 TOOH, ROTATE & PUMP OUT FIRST 2 STANDS, PULL 5 STANDS
18:30 - 19:00 0.50| CIRC |1 PUMP DRY SLUG
19:00 - 23:30 450/ TRP |12 TOOH W/ BIT # 14
23:30 - 00:30 100/ TRP |1 CHANGE OUT STABILIZED MUD MOTOR W/ SLICK MUD MOTOR. RERUN BIT #
14
00:30 - 05:30 500/ TRP |12 TIHW/BIT#15
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM TO 11306', PUMP SWEEP & CLEAN BOTTOM
3/29/2007  |06:00 - 13:00 7.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11306' TO 11474', WOB 28-30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2600 (HIGH
TORQUE)
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:30-06:00 | 1650/ DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11474 TO 11756', WOS 30, ROT 25, PS 200, PP 2300 (HIGH TORQUE
SOMETIMES STALLING TOP DRIVE)
3/30/2007  |06:00 - 08:00 2.00{ OTH TOTAL TIME WORKING PIPE F/ STALLED MUD MOTOR
08:00 - 09:00 1.00{DRL  [1 DRILL F/ 11756' TO 11772', WOB 26, PS 200, PP 2350 (HIGH TORQUE)
09:00 - 09:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE VALVE CAP & GASKET # 1 PUMP

DRILL F/ 11772 TO 11777', WOB 20-24, PS 200, PP 2350 (UNABLE TO ADD
MORE WIGHT STALLING MUD MOTOR)

09:30 - 10:30 1.00| DRL

-

10:30 - 11:30 1.00{ SUR 1 CIRCULATE & DROP SURVEY

11:30 - 20:00 8.50| TRP 12 TOOH W/ BIT # 15, PUMP & ROTATE 7 STANDS OFF BOTTOM

20:00 - 22:00 2.00{OTH RETRIEVE SURVEY, CHANGE OUT MUD MOTOR & BIT

22:00 - 04:30 6.50| TRP 2 TIH W/ BIT # 16 TO 11658

04:30 - 05:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM TO 11777' (PRECAUTIONARY)

05.00 - 06:00 1.00| DRL 1 DRILL F/ 11777 TO 11787', WOB 14, ROT 25, PS 200, PP 2700
3/31/2007 06.00 - 07:30 1.50| DRL 1 DRILL F/ 11787 TO 11827' WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2400

07:30 - 08:00 0.50| DRL 1 REPAIR WASHED VALVE CAP SEAT & REPLACE GASKET

08:00 - 09:00 1.00| DRL 1 DRILL F/ 11827 TO 11846', WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2400

09:00 - 09:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE

09:30 - 22:00 12.50| DRL 1 DRILL F/ 11846' TO 12039', WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2200

22:00 - 22:30 0.50| OTH AIR OUT PUMPS

22:30-01:00 2.50| DRL DRILL F/ 12039' TO 12068', WOB 20-24, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2200 (MUD MOTOR
STALLING W/ 22-24K ON BIT)

01:00 - 03:00 2.00; CIRC CIRCULATE & PUMP SWEEP

03:00 - 04:30 1.50/ OTH SAFETY MEETING. PUMP DOWN GYRODATA TOOL

-

-

04:30 - 06:00 1.50{ TRP 2 TOOH W/ GYRODATA TOOL
4/1/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50| TRP 2 TOOH W/ GYRODATA TOOL, PUMP & ROTATE 9 STANDS OFF BOTTOM

13:30- 16:30 3.00 OTH RETRIEVE GYRO TOOL, BREAK BIT & CHANGE OUT MUD MOTORS
(PROBLEMS DOWNLOADING DATA F/ TOOL TO COMPUTER, AFTER DOWN
LOADING GYRODATA TECH DID BATTERY CHECK LOOSING ALL DATA)

16:30 - 18:00 1.50| TRP 2 TIH TO CSG SHOE W/ BIT #17

18:00 - 19:30 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE

19:30 - 20:30 1.00| TRP 2 TIH TO 6509' (TIGHT)

20:30 - 22:00 1.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 6509' TO 6622'

22:00 - 00:00 2.00| TRP 2 TIH TO 10882

00:00 - 00:30 0.50| OTH INSTALL NEW ROTATING HEAD RUBBER

00:30-01:30 1.00| TRP TIHTO 11933’

01:30- 02:00 0.50| REAM WASH & REAM F/ 11933 TO 12022' (PRECAUTIONARY)

02:00 - 02:30 0.50| RIG CHANGE SWAB & ROD WASHER # 2 MUD PUMP

02:30- 03:00 0.50| REAM WASH & REAM F/ 12022 TO 12068' (PRECAUTIONARY)

03:00 - 06:00 3.00| DRL DRILL F/ 12068' TO 12121', WOB 20, ROT 20, PS 170, PP 1850
4/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| RIG SERVICE RIG, CHANGE GRABBER DIE ON TOP DRIVE, ATTEMPT TO

A aN=aN

Printed: 4/5/2007 8:20:04 AM



QuestarE & P Page 10 of 10
Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:

Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:(;’e Description of Operations

CALIBRATE BIT WIGHT ON PASON. CALLED PASON
CHANGE SWAB # 1 PUMP
DRILL F/ 12121' TO 12237', WOB 28-30, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 1950 (HIGH

4/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| RIG
07.30 - 08:00 0.50| RIG
08:00 - 18:00 10.00| DRL

- N -

TORQUE)

18:00 - 23:00 5.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 12237 TO 12277, WOB 20-25, ROT 35, PS 190, PP 2150 (HIGH
TORQUE, STALLING MUD MOTOR)

23:00 - 00:00 100|RIG |2 CHANGE SWAB # 2 PUMP

00:00 - 02:30 250/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 12277 TO 12301, WOB 20-22, ROT 30, PS 190, PP 2150 (STALLING
MUD MOTOR)

02:30 - 03:30 1.00{SUR |1 CIRCULATE & DROP SURVEY

03:30 - 06:00 250/TRP |12 |TOOH W/ BIT # 17 (ROTATE & PUMP 10 STANDS OFF BOTTOM, PULLED
TIGHT @ 11820° TO 11750", SPOT WEIGHTED PILL)

4/3/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50|TRP |12 |TOOH, PUMP & ROTATE STAND # 10 DRILL STRING PARTED 75' BELOW
ROTARY FLOOR (PIN END WHERE TUBE FRICTION WELDED TO TOOL JOINT
BROKE)

06:30 - 13:00 6.50| WOT |4 WAIT ON FISHING TOOLS

13:00 - 15:00 2.00| FISH 5 MAKE UP OVERSHOT & BUMPER SUB TIH TO 1006’ TAG FISH, ENGAGE FISH,
PULL 100000#, FISH STREING WEIGHT 250000#

15:00-17:00 2.00{ FISH 5 TOOH TO OVERSHOT & FISH, DISENGAGE FISH, HIGH DRAG IN CASING

17:00 - 01:00 8.00| FISH 5 TOOH LAYING DOWN 4-1/2" DROPPED DRILL PIPE (105.5 JOINTS - 3322

RECOVERED) TOP OF FISH 4-1/2" DP TUBE W/ DIMINSION OF 5-3/4" x 2-3/4"
@ 4328 (CASING SHOE @ 4267)

01:00 - 04:00 3.00/FISH |5 REARRANGE DRILL PIPE ON LOCATION, LAY OUT & STRAP 3-1/2" DP (WAIT
ON LONG SKIRTED MILL)

04:00 - 06:00 2.00| FISH P/U 3-1/2" DRILL PIPE

41412007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00| FISH FINISH P/U 108 JTS 3-1/2" DP

09:00 - 10:00 1.00| OTH RIG DOWN FRANKS LAY DOWN TRUCK

10:00 - 11:30 1.50| TRP TOOH STAND BACK 33 STANDS 3-1/2° OP

11:30 - 13:00 1.50| TRP P/U & M/U MILL, BUMPER SUB, JAR, 3 EA 6-1/2" DC & ENERGIZER

13:00 - 14:00 1.00| TRP TIH W/ FISHING ASSEMBLY TO 1346’

14:00 - 15:00 1.00{ OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB TO 3-1/2" IF & RESET TORQUE

S e,

N=aN

15:00 - 16:30 1.50| TRP 2 TIH TO 4288’

16:30 - 17:00 0.50| FISH 2 WASH DOWN OVER TOP OF FISH F/ 4288' TO 4292

17:00 - 06:00 13.00| FiSH 1 MILL ON FISH F/ 4292' TO 4294

4/5/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| FISH 1 MILL ON FISH F/ 4294' TO 4295.6' (RECOVER TOTAL 3.2 LB METALCUTTINGS)

12:30 - 15:00 2.50| TRP 2 TOOH W/ SKIRTED MILL (5.5 INCHS WORE OFF MILL SKIRT & 4 INCHES
CUTRITE INSIDE WORE OFF)

15:00 - 17:00 2.00| OTH L/D FISHING TOOLS, STRAP 4" XT39 $135 - 14# DP, CHANGE OUT
ELEVATORS & SLIPS

17:00 - 18:00 1.00| OTH R/U FRANKS LAY DOWN TRUCK & HOLD SAFETY MEETING

18:00 - 22:.00 4.00|OTH P/U 4" DRILL PIPE - 105 JTS

22.00-22:30 0.50, OTH R/D LAY DOWN TRUCK

22:30 - 00:00 1.50{ OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB & RESET TORQUE

00:00-01:30 1.50| TRP 2 TOOH STANDING BACK 35 STANDS 4" DP

01:30-02:30 1.00| OTH CHANGE ELEVATORS & M/U MILL, BIT SUB, BUMPER SUB & JARS

02:30 - 06:00 3.50| TRP 2 TIH W/ 5§ BLADED 8-1/2" MILL

Printed: 4/5/2007 8:20:04 AM



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER
ML 49279
6 IF INDIAN. ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS Ute Tribe
7 UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME
Co not use this form for proposals to dril new weils, sigruticantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth reenter plugged wells or to /
gnil honzontal laterals  Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO ORILL form for such proposals n/a
1 TYPE OF WELL 8 WELL NAME and NUMBER
OIL WELL GAS WELL V| OTHER
0 FR 7P-36-14-19
2 NAME OF OPERATOR 9 API NUMBER
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY 4304738992
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER 10 FIELD AND POOL. OR WILDCAT
1571 East 1700 South Vernal uTt 84078 (303) 308-3068 Undesignated
4 LOCATION OF WELL
FooTaces aTsurFace  1910' FSL x 162' FWL county Uintah
3)
QTRAQTR. SECTION TOwNSHIP RANGE MERIDAN NWSW 86 148 20E S STATE
UTAH
" CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
2E CEPE c
[Z] NoTicE OF mTENT (] aciz [C] oeeren [] RePERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
(Submit i Duplicate! [} aurercasmc [ rraciure raear 7] sioetrack ToRrePaR WELL
Approximale date work Wil start D CASING REPAIR D NEW CONSTRUCTION D TEMPORARILY ABANDON
4/20/2007 D CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [:] OPERATOR CHANGE D TUBING REPAIR
D CHANGE TUBING E] PLUG AND ABANDON [] ventor fFuare
(] sussequent RePORT [[] cHance welL nave [ rucsack [] water DisposaL
{Submit Orgnat Form Gniy;
D CHANGE WELL STATUS [:] PROCUCTIGN (START/RESUME) D WATER SHUT-CFF
Cate of work compietnn
[] comwinGLE PROBUCING FORMATIONS (] #ectamanion oF wel sive (] orver
D CONVERT WELL TYPE D RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS Ctearly show alt pertinent details including dates. depths, volumes. etc.

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY REQUESTS PERMISSION TO SIDETRACK THIS WELLBORE.
APRIL 3, 2007 THE DRILL STRING PARTED. EFFORTS TO REPAIR THE WELLBORE DOWNHOLE HAVE BEEN
SOMEWHAT SUCCESSFUL BUT NOT ALL OF THE DRILL STRING HAS BEEN RECOVERED. THERE ARE NO
ENVIRONMENTAL ISSUES ASSOCIATED WITH THE REMAINING DRILL STRING. ALL THAT WILL BE LEFT BEHIND IS A
STEEL FISH BELOW THE CEMENT PLUG.

QUESTAR PROPOSES TO SET A CEMENT PLUG FROM 10,400' TO 10,898' AND KICK OFF ABOVE THE PLUG AND
THEN CONTINUE OPERATIONS TO REACH THE BOTTOM HOLE OBJECTIVE WITHIN OUR LEGAL LOCATION TARGET
BOX. A WELLBORE DIAGRAM IS ATTACHED ALONG WITH A REVISED DIRECTIONAL SURVEY. QUESTAR DESIRES
TO BEGIN SETTING THE CEMENT PLUG THE EVENING OF APRIL 20, 2007.

name pLease privr,_D8DTa K. Stanperry . e Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

’ - -

C L
™ ol A S PATE

SIGNATURE = e N ey

COPY SENT ,
. Dale: ' :
D inilialy :

1
i

{This space for State use only)

15:2000)

il TN s e W




Flat Rock 7P-36-14-19

g2 Preset Casing @ 500
13-3/8" cemented to surface

9-5/8" 47 #/ft HCP-110
CSA 4200' Cemented to surface

Inclination of KOP @ 6° Top of Cmt Plug at 10,400'

320 sxs of 17.5 #/gal density

Yield 0.94 cu. ft/sx; 3.35 gals per sx
Type G cement w/ 0.5% WOC CFR-3
0.25%% WOC HR-12

Top of 4-1/2" DP at 10,898

Bottom of Cmt Plug @ 10,898'

Original TD - 12,301' 8-1/2" hole



Flat Rock 7P-36-14-19 Drillin

Report Date:  Apnl 20. 2007 Survey / DLS Computation Method: Minimum Curvature ¢ Lubinski
Client: Vertical Section Azimath: 305 100
Field: Uinta Vertical Section Origin: NQ Q00 ft, E0.000 ht
Structure / Slot:  Flat Rock / Wolf Flat/ Flat Rock 7P-36-14-19 TVD Reference Datum:
Well: Flat Rock 7P-36-14-19 TVD Reference Elevation: 7430 0 ft refative to MSL
Borehole: Onginai Hole Sea Bed/ Ground Level Eievation:  7166.000 ft relative to MSL
UWUAPIH: Magnetic Declination: 11.634
Survey Name / Date.  Forward Plan - February 28. 2007 Total Fietd Strength: 52477 766 nT
Tort/ AHD/DDI/ ERD ratio: 121834 2561 2611/5510:0.216 Magnetic Dip:  65.567
Grid Coordinate System: NADS3J Utah State Planes. Central Zone, US Feet Declination Date:  February 28 2007
Location LatLong: N 39 33 13.830 W 109 43 46.040 Magnetic Declination Model: IGRF 2005
Location Grid N'E ¥/X: N 7011157 375 #tUS. E 2139593.828 fiUS North Reference: True North
Grid Convergence Angle: +1 13417287 Totat Corr Mag North -> True North:  +11 634
Grid Scale Factor: 0 99991079 Local Coordinates Referenced To:  Well Head
Comments Me;;n::\ed Inclination Azimuth ™D ;::::': NS EW Closure S:::;: DLS Tool Face
(ft) {deg) {deg) (ft) (ft) (f) (i) (ft) {deg) (deg/iooft) {deg)
ILQJZV'S'O'" MWD 10383.00 606 32356 9940.73 247057 149150 197146 247209 307 11 082 -135.00G
Comung oft Plug 10583.00 4.61 256.64 1014003 2485.92 1498.14  .198556 2487.34 307.04 3.00 -103.36M
Hold 10683.00 4.61 256.64 10239.71 2491.25 1496.28  -1893.38 2492.47 306.89 0.00 0.00M
Drop 10913.41 0.00 0.00 10469.87 2497.39 1494 14 -2002.39 2498.40 306.73 2.00 0.00M
0 12293.54 0.00 0.00 11850.00 2497.39 1494.14  -2002.39 2498.40 306.73 0.00 0.00M

Survey Type: Detinitive Proposal

Survey Error Model: SL.B ISCWSA version 22 *** 3-D 95.00% Confidence 2.7955 sigma

Surveying Prog:

MD From (ft)
0.00

264.00
2054.00
10383.00

WaeliDesign Ver Bid( doc40x 37 )

MDTo(ft] EOU Freq Survey Tool Type

264.00
2054.00
10383.00
12293.54

Act-Stns SLB_EMS-STD-Depth Oniy
Act-Stns SLB EMS-STD
Act-Stns SLB MWD-STD

Borehole -> Survey

Original Hole
Qriginal Hole
Original Hole

1/100.00 SLB UNKNOWN (default toot used) Original Hole

-> SS and MWD Surveys
-> 88§ and MWD Surveys
-> §S and MWD Surveys
->» Forward Plan

Flat Rock 7P-36-14-19'Flat Rock 7P-36-14-19\0Original Hole\Forward Blenerated 4/20/2007 6:49 AM Page 1 ol 1



Schiumberger
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| (4/20/2007) Dustin -FR “Page 1]

From: "Debbie Stanberry” <Debbie.Stanberry@questar.com>
To: "Dustin Doucet" <DUSTINDOUCET@utah.gov>

Date: 4/20/2007 11:38 AM

Subject: FR 7P-36-14-19

CC: "Jan Nelson" <jan.nelson@questar.com>

Dustin: attached is a Sundry requesting permission to sidetrack
Questar's FR 7P-36-14-19 well. Drill string parted several weeks ago
and we have got as much drill string out as we are able to. With your
permission we will set a cement plug and kick off to continue with our
drilling operations in order to reach TD. KOP is approximately 10,400’
and total depth should be approximately 12,450' MD. I'l follow up with
a phone call this afternoon so that you can have time to look this over.
Let me know if you need something additional.

Debbie Stanberry

(303) 308-3068
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QuestarE & P Page 1 of 16
Operations Summary Report
Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:3‘| 30> 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT q‘rj,_‘ ) L/7—-38 772 Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code ngjdbe Description of Operations
2/8/2007 [06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 RIG DOWN 60% RIG MOVE 5%
118:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: WILL LOWER DERRICK THIS MORNING, TOP DRIVE & POWER UNIT
TRUCKED TO GRAND JUNCTION, COLO FOR REPAIRS
2/9/2007 06:00-18:00 |  12.00/LOC |4 RIG DOWN 65% - RIG MOVE 15% (TOTAL 8 HAUL TRUCKS, 2 BED TRUCKS, 2
CRANES, 1 LOADER - BLACKHILLS)
{18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: RIG MOVE 90 MILES ONE WAY, ROAD CONDITIONS BAD
i APPROXIMATELY 70 MILES DUE TO THAW. 8 HOURS ROUND TRIP TRUCK.
2/10/2007  106:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 80% RIG DOWN - 20% MOVE (1 TRAILER DOWN BRAKES, 1 TRUCK DOWN
: FAN BELT, 1 TRUCK REBUILDING MUD CHAINS) 4 LOADS TODAY
{18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: 1 MORE HAUL TRUCK THIS AM, 2 GIN TRUCKS TODAY, 1 HAUL TRUCK
‘ TOMORROW
2/11/2007  06:00-18:00 | 1200/LOC |4 RIG DOWN 95% RIG MOVE 30 % (8 LOADS OFF LOCATION WILL SET
‘ MATTING BOARDS & SUB TODAY ON 7P LOCATION. ESTIMATE MOVE CAMP
TUES. 13TH)
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT (RAIN PM)
- NOTE: 1 TRUCK & TRAILER REPAIRED, 3 MORE TRUCKS ON LOCATION
TODAY
2/12/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LO0C |3 RIG DOWN 95% (CAMP LEFT TO RIG DOWN, WILL MOVE TUES 13TH) RIG
MOVE 40% (6 LOADS) RIG UP 5% (SET MATTING BOARDS & LOWER
SUBSTRUCTURE)
18:00-06:00 |  12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/13/2007  106:00-18:00 | 1200/LOC |3 RIG DOWN 95% WILL RIG DOWN CAMPS TODAY RIG MOVE 65% 6 BIG LOADS
AND TUBULARS LEFT ON LOCATION, SUB BASE IN PLACE ON 7P, TRUCKS
GETTING STUCK ON MAIN ROAD WILL HAVE BLADES HELP WITH RIG MOVE
TODAY
18:00-06:00 | 12.00{LOC (3 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/14/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 1200{LOC |3 MOVE 5 CAMPS FROM FR 11 TO FR3 RIG MOVE 70%, RIG UP 5%
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/15/2007  i06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |3 RIG UP CAMPS, SET IN DRAWWORKS, FLOOR MOTORS AND TOP DOG
HOUSE, RIG MOVE 75%, RIG UP 10%
18:00-06:00 | 12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/16/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00[LOC |3 SET IN SHALE SHAKERS, GAS BUSTER, MUD CLEANER AND #2 PUMP
DERRICK HALF PINNED TOGHETHER, TUBULARS AND MUD, FLARE BOW
AND BOUYE AND FLARE LINES LEFT TO MOVE FROM 11P
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/17/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 RIG 85% MOVED, RIG UP 30%, SET MUD PUMPS AND MUD TANKS FINISH
PINNING DERRICK TOGHETHER
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/18/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 PIN IN DERRICK, SET IN SUIT CASES AND OUT BUILDINGS AND REMIANING
SHACKS RIG 90% RIG UP 60%
18:00-06:00 |  12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/19/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 HOOK UP AIR, STEAM, WATER AND FUEL LINES SET DEER STANDS RIG UP
75%, RIG MOVE 95% EVERYTHING IS OFF FR11P, WILL WELD WELLHEAD ON
TODAY AND STRING BLOCKS, RAISE DERRICK
2/20/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 STRING BLOCKS AND RAISE DERRICK, WELD ON WELLHEAD, SET IN AIR
: PACKAGE AND MUD, GENERAL RIG UP. WILL SET TOP DRIVE UNIT AND RIG
UP 2/20, NIPPLE UP AND PRESSURE TEST 2/21 DRILL 2/22. RIG MOVE 100%,
RIG UP 80%
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/21/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 BRIDLE DOWN, HYDROMATIC FROZE HAD TO THAW OUT FOR BLOCKS TO
I
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 3}.36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code CS(;"dbe Description of Operations
2/21/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 MOVE, IN STALL TORQUE TUBE AND RIG UP FLOOR, FIRE BOILER AND
CHECK FOR LEAKS, RUN AIR COMPRESSORS, RIG UP 90% WILL FINISH
RIGGING UP TOP DRIVE AND NIPPLE UP 2/21
18:00- 06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/22/2007  |06:00-18:00 |  12.00| OTH RIG UP TOP DRIVE
18:00-05:00 | 11.00 BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOP
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|BOP |2 TEST BOP 250 LOW AND 5000 HUGH, STAND PIPE AND BAG TO 250 LOW
AND 5000 HIGH
2/23/2007  |06:00 - 11:30 5.50(BOP |2 TEST BOP, LOWER PIPES, BLINDS, UPPER PIPES, KELLY COCK, HCR,
CHOKE MANNIFOLD AND FLOOR VALVES 5000 HIGH AND 250 LOW, STAND
PIPE AND BAG 3500 HIGH AND 250 LOW ALL TESTED OK
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| OTH SET WEAR BUSHING
12:00 - 18:00 6.00| OTH REFABRICATE BUOYE LINE AND STRING FLARE LINE AND PANIC LINE
18:00 - 19:00 1.00| OTH DRILL AND SET MOUSEHOLE
19:00 - 20:00 1.00{TRP 1 MAKE UP BHA
20:00 - 20:30 050/RIG |2 REPAIR SERVICE LOOP ON TOP DRIVE
20:30 - 02:00 550/ TRP |1 PICK UP BHA
02:00 - 03:00 1.00|RIG |2 CHANGE 10" VALVE ON FLOW LINE
03:00 - 06:00 3.00/DRL |4 DRILL CEMENT TAG @ 468' DRILL CEMENT TO 530'
2/24/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 200/DRL |1 DRILL F/548' TO 680' WOB 15,ROT 70, AR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 190
08:00 - 08:30 0.50| SUR |1 SURVEY @ 655' .6 INC 293.98 AZM
08:30 - 14:00 5.50/DRL |1 DRILL F/680° TO 1044’ WOB 25, ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6GPM, PP 230
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
14:30 - 15:30 1.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/1044' TO 1437' WOB 25, ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 230
15:30 - 16:00 050/ SUR |1 SURVEY @ 1129' .8 INC 318.18 AZM
16:00 - 23:30 750{DRL |1 DRILL F/1137' TO 1594’ WOB 30, ROT 65, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 255
23:30 - 00:00 0.50{SUR |1 SURVEY @ 1570' .8 INC 323.38 AZM
00:00 - 06:00 6.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/1584' TO 1967' WOB 30, ROT 65, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 310
MAKING VERY LITTLE WATER
2/25/2007  |06:00 - 07:45 1.75[DRL |1 DRILL F/1967' TO 2062' WOB 35, ROT 65, AIR 2800 CFM, PP 310 MAKING VERY
LITTLE WATER
07:45 - 08:15 0.50| SUR |1 SURVEY @ 2054' 1.4 INC 350.38 AZM
08:15 - 12:00 375/DRL |1 DRILL F/2062' TO 2249' WOB 35, ROT 60, 2800 CFM, 6 GPM, PP 314 WATER
PICKING UP FROM HOLE
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:30 - 16:00 3.50/DRL |1 DRILL F/2249' TO 2457 WOB 35, ROT 60, 2800 CFM, 6 GPM, PP 410 MAKING
WATER
16:00 - 20:00 4.00{TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO PiCK UP DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS, LAY DOWN IBS AND BIT SUB
20:00 - 22:00 200/RIG |2 CHANGE ACCUATOR VALVE ON TOP DRIVE
22:00 - 01:00 300(TRP |1 PICK UP DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS AND ORIENT
01:00 - 04:30 3.50|TRP |2 TRIP IN, TEST MWD AT 650'
04:30 - 05:00 0.50| REAM |1 BREAK CIRCULATION, WASH & REAM LAST STD TO BOTTOM
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|RIG |2 WORK ON #1 PUMP
2/26/2007 | 06:00 - 06:30 050|RIG |2 REPLACE CAP GASKET ON #1 PUMP
06:30 - 08:00 1.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/2457' TO 2484 WOB 35, ROT 25, PS 170, PP 950, AIR 1000, MAKING
VERY LITTLE WATER
08:00 - 09:30 150|RIG |2 CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB
09:30 - 13:30 400/DRL |2 DRILL F/2484' TO 2577' WOB 40, ROT 25, PS 140, PP 850, AIR 1800, LOSING
FLUID, INCREASE AIR AND DECREASE PUMPS SLIDE 12 ROTATE 20'
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
14:00-03:30 | 13.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 2577' TO
03:30 - 06:00 250{SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEYS
2/27/2007  |06:00 - 15:00 9.00{DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3020’ TO 3327' WOB 40K, PS 140, PP 850, AIR 1800 {(MAINTAINING
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 3] 36<14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
2/27/2007  |06:00 - 15:00 9.00|DRL |2 VOLUME IN PITS)
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30-03:00 | 1150/ DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3327' TO 3975', WOB 40-42K, PS 140, PP 925, AIR 1800 (MAINTAINING
VOLUME IN RESERVE PIT)
03:00 - 06:00 3.00{SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
2/28/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 300/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3975' TO 4083', WOB 42-46K, ROT 40, PS 70, PP 1000, AIR 1800
09:00 - 09:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
09:30 - 14:30 500/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4083' TO 4227', WOB 46-48K, ROT 40, PS 60, PP 800, AIR 1600 (LOST
RETURNS)
14:30 - 15:30 1.00| OTH REGAIN CIRCULATION
15:30 - 16:30 1.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4227' TO 4290', WOB 46-48K, ROT 40, PS 70, PP 1025, AIR 1800
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00 - 18:30 0.50/ CIRC {1 CIRCULATE
18:30 - 20:30 200|TRP |15  |WIPER TRIP TO 2343' (FIRST 4 STANDS TIGHT, ROTATE & PUMP)
20:30 - 23:00 250|CIRC |1 ATTEMPT CIRCULATE FAWATER FLOW. GAINED +/- 700 BBL IN RESERVE
23:00 - 01:30 250(TRP |15  |WIPER TRIP TO BHA & STAGE IN HOLE
01:30 - 02:30 1.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM LAST 4 STANDS
02:30 - 03:30 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE
03:30 - 06:00 250|TRP |2 TOOH F/ WIRELINE LOGS (SLM)
3/1/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250/ TRP |2 FINISH TOOH F/ LOGS (SLM 4286.82' - 3.18' DIFFERENCE IN TALLY, NO
CHANGE)
08:30 - 09:00 0.50| TRP |1 L/D MWD TOOL & BIT
09:00 - 11:00 200{LOG |1 SAFETY MEETING & R/U SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS
11:00 - 12:30 1.50|LOG |1 RIH TO 1000' W/ RUN # 1, PLATFORM EXPRESS. TOOL FAILURE - GAMMA
RAY
12:30 - 14:00 150|L0G |1 POOH REPAIR TOOL WHILE WAITING OTHER TOOL FROM VERNAL
14:00 - 15:30 1.50/LOG |1 TEST TOOL, RIH TO 2420', BRIDGED OFF, POOH (LOGGERS FOUND FLUID
LEVEL @ 1235
15:30 - 16:30 1.00{LOG |1 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS
16:30 - 18:30 200/ TRP |1 /D MUD MOTOR, MWD & MONEL. P/U BIT SUB & IBS
18:30 - 20:30 200|{TRP |2 TIH TO 2422
20:30 - 22:00 1.50] REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 2422' TO 2680"
22:00 - 23:00 1.00|TRP |2 TIH F/ 2680" TO 3908
23:00 - 01:30 2.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 3908’ TO 4290'
01:30 - 02:30 1.00|CIRC {1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE
02:30 - 06:00 350|TRP |2 TOOH TO RUN 9-5/8" CASING, /D 8" DC
- NOTE: NOTIFIED DAN JARVIS W/ UTAH OGM OF INTENT TO RUN CSG &
CEMENT @ 1645 HOURS 2/28/2007
3/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| OTH LAY DOWN 8" DC & PULL WEAR BUSHING
07:30 - 09:00 150{CSG |1 SAFETY MEETING & R/U WEATHERFORD CASING CREW
09:00 - 15:00 6.00/CSG |2 RUN 96 JTS 9-5/8", P110, 47#LT&C CSG, TIGHT @ 3935
15:00 - 16:00 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP & WORK 1 JT CSG THROUGH TIGHT SPOT F/ 3935’ TO 3950' (NO
RETURNS)
16:00 - 16:30 0.50|CSG |2 RUN 3 JTS CSG, TIGHT @ 4120'
16:30 - 20:00 350/ CIRC |1 PUMP & WORK 2 JTS CSG & LANDING JT F/ 4120° TO 4223' (LAST 44 ' NOT
TIGHT) LAND CASING W/ SHOE @ 4267' & FLOAT COLLAR @ 4177 (NO
RETURNS)
20:00 - 00:00 4.00{ OTH INSTALL PACKOFF & PRESSURE TEST W/ 5000 PSI. INSTALL CEMENT
ISOLATION TOOL
00:00 - 01:00 1.00| CMT |1 R/U HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS & HOLD SAFETY MEETING
01:00 - 06:00 500|CMT |2 TEST CMT LINES W/ 5000 PSI, TEST N2 LINES W/ 8000 PSI. PUMP 10 BBL

FRESH WATER, 20 BBL OF FOAMED SUPER FLUSH & 10 BBL FOAMED
WATER. PUMP 180 BBL. (688 SKS) FOAMED LEAD CMT W/ 8.5 PPG DENSITY &
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 3]38’- 14-S 19-E 26

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:

Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code gc:]dbe Description of Operations
3/2/2007 01:00 - 06:00 5.00|CMT |2 1.47/YIELD. PUMP 35 BBL (134 SKS) FOAMED LEAD CMT W/ 11 PPG DENSITY
& 1.47/YIELD. PUMP 44.9 BBL (172 SKS) TAIL CMT W/ 14.3 PPG DENSITY &
1.47/YIELD. DROP PLUG & DISPLACE W/ 308 BBL WATER. BUMP PLUG W/ 800
PSI. FLOAT HELD. NO RETURNS DURING ENTIRE JOB. PUMP 20.7 BBL (75
SKS) CAP CMT W/ 14.6 PPG DENSITY & 1.55/YIELD
3/3/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| WOT |1 R/D CEMENTERS - WOC
07:30 - 08:30 1.00{WOT |1 L/D LANDING JT & INSTALL WEAR BUSHING - WOC
08:30 - 11:00 250/ WOT |1 LAY OUT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS - WOC
11:00 - 12:00 1.00/EQT |1 R/U B&C QUICK TEST & PRESSURE TEST CASING W/ 1500 PSI F/ 30 MIN - OK
12:00 - 18:00 6.00| RIG 5 THAW STANDPIPE & KELLY HOSE
18:00 - 19:30 150|DRL |3 P/U DIRECTIONAL TOOLS & ORIENT
19:30 - 22:00 250/ TRP |2 TIH W/ BIT #4, TAG CEMENT @ 4172
22:00 - 23:30 1.50| OTH REPLACE VALVE ON FLOWLINE & REPAIR LEAK
23:30 - 01:00 150/ DRL |4 DRILL FLOAT EQUIPMENT, CEMENT POCKET & 10' NEW HOLE TO 4300'
01:00 - 02:30 150/ EQT |2 CIRCULATE & FIT W/ 8.5# MUD W/ 682 PSI = EMW 11.59# (PRESSURE
DROPPED F/ 685 TO 682 15 MIN)
02:30 - 05:30 300/DRL |2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/ 4300' TO 4390', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1350.
SLIDE TO BUILD ANGLE
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| OTH CONNECTION & SURVEYS
31412007 06:00 - 06:30 050/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4390' TO 4395', WOB 12, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1350
06:30 - 07:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT LINER & SWAB # 1 PUMP
07:30 - 16:00 850[DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4395' TO 4582, WOB 10, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1200 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO BUILD ANGLE - 6 SLIDES @ 5.2 HRS)
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
17:30 - 19:00 1.50| RIG 2 STANDPIPE HAMMER UNION LEAKING, REPLACE STANDPIPE HAMMER
UNION O-RING
19:00 - 03:00 800{DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4582' TO 4750', WOB 10, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1250 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO BUILD ANGLE - 5 SLIDES @ 5.4 HRS)
03:00 - 04:00 1.00{| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
04:00 - 06:00 2.00| RIG 2 REPLACE MODULE WEAR RING & LINER # 1 PUMP
3/5/2007 06:00 - 06:30 050/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4750' TO 4770', WOB 10-12, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1300
06:30 - 07:30 1.00| RIG 1 RIG & TOP DRIVE SERVICE
07:30 - 14:00 6.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4770' TO 4982, WOB 10-12, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 1900 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
14:00 - 15:30 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| CIRC MIX & PUMP DRY SLUG
16:00 - 19:30 350|TRP |12 TOOH W/ BIT # 4 (MOTOR WEAK. UNABLE TO SLIDE)
19:30 - 20:30 1.00| OTH CHANGE OUT MUD MOTOR & BITS
20:30 - 22:00 150{ TRP |2 TIH W/ BIT #5 TO 3900'
22:00 - 23:30 1.50( RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE
23:30 - 00:30 1.00|TRP |2 TIH TO 4875’
00:30 - 01:00 0.50 REAM |1 WASH & REAM LAST STAND (PRECAUTIONARY)
01:00 - 05:00 400/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4982' TO 5120', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 1980 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/6/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5120' TO 5257, WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 2 PASON REPLACED FLOW METER SENSOR BOX
14:30 - 16:30 2.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5257 TO 5361', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00-04:30 | 10.50|/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5361’ TO 5695', WOB 12-14, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 3] 36 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code gg’dbe Description of Operations
3/6/2007 18:00-04:30 | 1050/ DRL |2 NEEDED TO BULD ANGLE)
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
- NOTE: WHEN ORIENTATING THE TOOL THE WRONG OFFSET WAS
ENTERED. 31 WAS SCRIBED & 301 SHOULD HAVE BEEN. THIS WAS FOUND 8
HRS AFTER SART DRILLING & READJUSTED.
3/7/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT LINER & SWAB # 1 PUMP
07:00 - 14:30 750{DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5695' TO 5892, WOB 12-14, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2100 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO HOLD ANGLE)
14:30 - 15:00 0.50{ RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:00 - 17:00 200/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5892' TO 5985', WOB 12-14, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2100 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO HOLD ANGLE)
17:00 - 18:00 1.00{ OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00-04:30 | 1050/ DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5985' TO 6297, WOB 14-18, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2150
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
- NOTE: 10-12 OZ METAL ON DITCH MAGNET
3/8/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50[DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6297 TO 6421, WOB 8-12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2050 (ROTATE W/
REDUCED ROP & ATTEMPT TO HELP BUILD ANGLE)
13:30 - 14:30 1.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
14:30 - 15:00 0.50{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & PUMP DRY SLUG
15:00 - 19:00 400|TRP |10 TOOH W/ BIT#5
19:00 - 20:00 100/ TRP |2 CHANGE BITS, REDIAL MOTOR TO 1.83, CHANGE BATTERIES & ORIENT MWD
20:00 - 22:00 200/ TRP |10 TIH W/ BIT #6 TO SHOE ]
22:00 - 06:00 8.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE (TESCO POWER UNIT ENGINE LEAKING OIL INTO RADIATOR)
WAIT ON OIL COOLER FROM GRAND JUNCTION
3/9/2007 06:00 - 14:30 8.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AT SHOE, TESCO WAITING ON OIL COOLER FOR POWER UNIT
14:30 - 18:30 400/ CIRC |1 CIRCULATE, INSTALL NEW OIL COOLER & FLUSH RADIATOR 4 TIMES
18:30 - 01:00 650/ TRP |2 RIG DOWN CIRCULATING HOSE & TIH F/ 3990' TOTAL 16 STDS, WASH &
REAM F/ 4652' TO 4736' - 4842 TO 5202 - 5890' TO 6168' & 6360' TO 6421’
TOTAL 9 STDS
01:00 - 05:30 450/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6421' TO 6514', WOB 12-14, ROT 20, PS 90, PP 2000
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| OTH CONNECTION & SURVEYS
3/10/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 200/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6514' TO 6544', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1800
08:00 - 08:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
08:30 - 17:30 9.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6544’ TO 6648', WOB 14-16, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1850
17:30 - 18:00 0.50/ OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00 - 02:00 8.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6648' TO 6731', WOB 18-22, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1850
02:00 - 03:30 1.50| RIG 2 RETRIEVE DP SCREEN
03:30 - 04:00 050|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6731' TO 6739' WOB 22, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1850
04:00 - 04:30 0.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
04:30 - 05:00 050/ CIRC |1 MIX & PUMP DRY SLUG
05:00 - 06:00 100|TRP 10 TOOH W/ BIT #6
3/11/2007  |06:00 - 11:30 550/ TRP |2 TOOH W/BIT #6
11:30 - 13:00 150/ TRP |2 CHANGE OUT BIT & MUD MOTOR, ORIENT MWD (MOTOR 1.5 BEND)
13:00 - 21:00 8.00| TRP |2 TIH W/ BIT # 7 TO 2920 (TOOH 13 STANDS TO RETRIEVE DP SCREEN) TiH TO
4393', WASH & REAM F/ 4393 TO 4399, 4645' TO 4652, 4921' TO 4955', 5024'
TO 5044', 5099' TO 5105', 5121' TO 5143, 5368' TO 5402', 5765' TO 5794', 5894'
TO 5984’
21:00 - 22:00 1.00{CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN
22:00 - 23:30 150/ TRP |2 TIH F/ 5984’ TO 6739' (WASH & REAM)
23:30 - 01:30 200/ DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6739' TO 6827', WOB 16, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1900
- OTH DAYLIGHT SAVINGS TIME
02:30 - 06:00 350/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6827' TO 6910', WOB 16, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1900
3/12/2007  |06:00 - 12:30 6.50 DRL |2 DRILL F/ 6910' TO 7014', WOB 14, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1800 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 3) 36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code g;dbe Description of Operations
3/12/2007  |06:00 - 12:30 650/DRL |2 TO HOLD ANGLE)
12:30 - 13:30 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, CHANGE OIL IN SWIVEL
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE VALVE CAP GASKETS # 1 PUMP
14:00 - 21:30 750/ DRL |2 DRILL F/ 7014' TO 7264', WOB 16, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1850 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO HOLD ANGLE)
21:30 - 22:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE LINER GASKET # 1 PUMP
22:00 - 03:30 550{DRL |2 DRILL F/ 7264’ TO 7449, WOB 16, ROT 20 PS 150, PP 1800 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO HOLD ANGLE
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE POPOFF VALVE # 1 PUMP
04:00 - 06:00 2.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/13/2007  {06:00 - 09:30 350/DRL |2 DRILL F/7449' TO 7556' WOB 16, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2100 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB ON #1 PUMP
10:00 - 10:30 0.50/DRL |2 DRILL F/7556' TO 7575' WOB 16, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2100
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
11:00-22:00 | 11.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/7575' TO 7797' WOB 17, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2200 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE UNABLE TO SLIDE WEIGHT DROPPING ON BIT STALLING MOTOR
22:00 - 23:00 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND MIX DRY PIPE PILL
23:00 - 03:00 400/ TRP |10 TRIP OUT BIT #7 TIGHT OFF BOTTOM 70000 OVERPULL
03:00 - 04:00 1.00|TRP |1 PICK UP TRICONE BIT #8 AND SET MOTOR @ 1.83
04:00 - 06:00 2.00{TRP |10 TRIP IN WITH BIT #8 PULSE TEST
3/14/2007  |06:00 - 08:00 2.00{TRP |10 TRIP IN BIT #8
08:00 - 10:30 250/ REAM |1 WASH AND REAM 7574' TO 7797"
10:30-04:00 | 1750/ DRL |2 DRILL F/7797° TO 8025' WOB 45, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2150 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE RUNNING 10 GPM TO BUILD VOLUME LOSING 15 GPM
04:00 - 06:00 200/SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY
3/15/2007  |06:00 - 13:00 7.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8025' T/ 8131', MW-9.3, VIS-42, WOB-45, ROT-25, PS-188, PP-2300,
SLIDE TO MAINTAIN ANGLE,
13:00 - 13:30 0.50/DRL |1 SERVICE RIG
13:30 - 17:00 350/DRL  [1 DRILL F/8131' T/8204'
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP
18:00-04:00 | 10.00/DRL {1 DRILL F/8204' T/ 8413'
04:00 - 06:00 200/SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/16/2007  |06:00 - 11:30 550[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8413 T/ 8504', WOB-45, RPM 130, PS- 185, PP- 2300PSI, MW-9.3,
VIS-42 4
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE & TOP DRIVE
12:00 - 13:00 100/ SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
13:00 - 19:00 6.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8504' T/ 8590’
19:00 - 22:00 300/TRP |10 POOH
22:00 - 06:00 8.00 ISP 1 INSPECT BHA 45 JTS HWDP, 6 COLLARS
3/17/2007 | 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| ISP 1 INSPECT BHA
07:30 - 08:30 1.00|TRP |1 P/U MUD MOTOR, CROSS OVER SUB
08:30 - 09:30 1.00|TRP |2 TIH, MWD NOT SENDING SIGNAL
09:30 - 10:00 050/ TRP  [13 TRIP QUT TO CHECK MWD COMMUNICATION
10:00 - 13:30 350/ DRL |3 MWD FAILURE, TOOL IS NOT RECIEVING DOWN LOAD, TRYING ANOTHER
TOOL
13:30 - 17:30 400/ TRP |2 TIH, TIGHT SPOT @ 4804'
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/4804' T/ 4907'
18:00 - 20:00 200{TRP |2 TIH BIT #9
20:00 - 21:00 1.00| REAM {1 WASH & REAM F/ 8519, T/8590'
21:00 - 22:30 150{DRL |1 DRILL F/8590° T/8600', MW-9.4, VIS- 42, STKS- 168, PP- 1890PSI, WOB 12K,
ROT 30 RPM,
22:30 - 23:30 100|DRL |2 ATTEMPT TO SLIDE F/8600' MADE 2 FT, SURVEY
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 3136f 14-S 19-E 26

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:

Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Sub o .
Date From - To | Hours | Code Code Description of Operations
3/17/2007  |23:30 - 00:00 0.50[DRL |1 DRILL F/3602' T/8612'
00:00 - 03:30 350|/DRL |2 SLIDE F/8612' T/ 8624 PUMPED SWEEP TO HELP SLIDE
03:30 - 06:00 250[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8624 T/8665
3/18/2007  |06:00 - 12:30 6.50/ DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8665' T/ 8758, MW- 9.3, VIS-41, WOB-24K, ROP-22FT/HR, STKS-177,
PP- 1870 PSI, ROTARY-32,
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, REPLACE VALVE IN # 1 MUD PUMP
13:00 - 22:00 9.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/8758' T/8943
22:00 - 00:00 2.00{SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
00:00 - 06:00 6.00DRL |1 DRILL F/8943 T/9073'
3/19/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 500/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 9073' T/ 9250', MW-9.4, VIS- 42, PP- 2200PSI, STKS- 189,
ROP-45FT/HR, 20K WOB, ROT-35 RPM,
11:00 - 12:00 1.00{SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS, SURVEY EVERY 30'
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:30 - 13:30 1.00{ OTH REMOVE & REPLACE 1 VALVE TO HELP SLIDE
13:30-01:00 | 11.50/DRL |4 DRILL F/9250' T/ 9530 , SLIDE TO MAINTAIN ANGLE
01:00 - 02:00 1.00| OTH REMOVE & REPLACE 1 VALVE TO HELP SLIDE
02:00 - 05:00 3.00/DRL |2 DRILL F/9530 T/ 9595 SLIDING TO MAINTAIN ANGLE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/20/2007  {06:00 - 12:30 6.50/DRL |2 DRILL F/9595' TO 9781' WOB 12, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2350 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE SLIDING 2 HOURS WANTING DROP ANGLE TO FAST
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:00 - 16:30 350/DRL |2 DRILL F/9781' TO 9982' WOB 12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
16:30 - 17:30 1.00{SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY TIME
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| OTH CRIPPLE PUMP
18:00 - 02:00 800/DRL |2 DRILL F/9982' TO 10189' WOB 12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
02:00 - 03:30 150|RIG (2 REPLACE PUMP ROD #2 PUMP
03:30 - 04:00 050{DRL |2 DRILL F/1018¢' TO 10217' WOB 12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
04:00 - 05:00 1.00/SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{DRL |2 SLIDING F/10217' TO 10221'
3/21/2007  |06:00 - 06:30 050/ CIRC |1 PUMP PILL
06:30 - 12:30 6.00{ TRP |10 TRIP OUT BIT #9 HIGH DRAG OFF BOTTOM PULLING 120 OVER
12:30 - 15:00 250/ TRP |10 TRIP IN BIT #10 TO SHOE CHANGE BHA PICK UP DRILL COLLARS
15:00 - 16:00 1.00{RIG |6 SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE
16:00 - 18:00 200{TRP |10 TRIP IN TO 7700' SWIVEL PACKING LEAKING
18:00 - 19:30 150[RIG |2 CHANGE SWIVEL PACKING
19:30 - 21:30 200/ TRP 10 TRIP IN FILL PIPE SWIVEL PACKING LEAKING
21:30 - 00:00 250/RIG |2 CHANGE SWIVEL PACKING
00:00 - 05:00 5.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 9920' TO 10219' DUE TO HIGH TORQUE BOTTOMS
UP FLARE 30'
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{DRL |2 DRILL F/10219' TO 10239' WOB 20, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2400
3/22/2007  |06:00 - 15:00 9.00{DRL |2 DRILL F/10239' TO 10411' WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550 SLIDE TO DROP
ANGLE
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| OTH WORK TORQUE OUT IN HOLE
15:30 - 16:00 050/DRL |2 DRILL F/10411' TO 10433' WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550
16:00 - 16:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 17:00 050/ DRL |2 DRILL F/10433' TO 10452' WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550
17:00 - 18:00 1.00{SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY TIME
18:00-04:30 | 1050|DRL |2 DRILL F/10452' TO 10746' WOS 30, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550 SLIDE TO DROP
ANGLE AND MAINTAIN AZM
04:30 - 06:00 150|SUR |1 CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS
3/23/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 500|DRL |2 DRILL F/10746' TO 10807 WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2650 SLIDE TO DROP
ANGLE
11:00 - 11:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 4| 36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code Csc:jdbe Description of Operations
3/23/2007  [11:30 - 12:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE SWAB ROD ON #2 PUMP
12:00 - 17:00 500/DRL |2 DRILL F/10807' TO 10867' WOB 35, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2650 LAST SURVEY
HAD .63 INC
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB ON #1 PUMP
17:30 - 18:00 0.50/SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY
18:00 - 20:30 250/DRL 2 DRILL F/10867' TO 10878' WOB 15, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2650 FRACTURED AND
HIGH TORQUE
20:30 - 21:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE
21:00 - 05:00 8.00| TRP |10 TRIP OUT BIT #10 BACK REAM FIRST 12 STDS
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|TRP |1 LAY DOWN DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS
3/24/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 100|TRP |1 LAY DOWN DIRRECTION TOOLS
07:00 - 07:30 0.50/ OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
07:30 - 12:30 5.00/BOP |2 TEST BOP, FLOOR VALVES, RAMS AND CHOKE TO 250 LOW AND 5000 HIGH,
BAG AND STAND PIPE TO 250 LOW AND 3500 HIGH
12:30 - 18:00 5.50 TRIP IN WITH BIT #11
18:00 - 18:30 0.50 REAM |1 WASH AND REAM 2 STDS TO BOTTOM, NO ROTATION DUE TO STALLING
TOP DRIVE
18:30 - 21:30 3.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/10878' TO 10889’ COULD NOT ROTATE, STALLING TOP DRIVE TRY
TO SLIDE AHEAD WEIGHT HANGING UP ON WALL
21:30 - 23:00 150/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO LAY DOWN DC, BACK REAM FIRST 10 STDS OUT
23:00 - 23:30 0.50/ CIRC |1 PUMP DRY PIPE PILL
23:30 - 06:00 650 TRP |2 TRIP OUT
3/25/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 §.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN BIT #12 ONE DRILL COLLAR IN STRING
11:00 - 12:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM LAST 3 STDS TO BOTTOM HIGH TORQUE
12:00 - 15:00 3.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/10889' TO 10943' WOB 45, ROT 45, PS 180, PP 2300 TORQUE
DECREASING
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30-06:00 | 14.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/10943' TO 11078' WOB 45, ROT 45, PS 190, PP 2350
3/26/2007  |06:00 - 06:30 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/11078' TO 11095' WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 190, PP 2350
06:30 - 07:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
07:00 - 14:00 700/DRL |1 DRILL F/11095' TO 11155' WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2350
14:00 - 14:30 050/ SUR |1 DROP SURVEY
14:30 - 22:00 750|TRP {10 TRIP OUT BIT #12 BACK REAM FIRST FOUR STANDS
22:00 - 00:30 250/ TRP |10 TRIP IN BIT #13 TO 5400'
00:30 - 02:00 1.50| RIG 2 #2 PUMP CLUTCH HABGING UP CHANGE QUICK RELEASE
02:00 - 04:30 250/ TRP |10 FINISH TRIP IN
04:30 - 05:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM LAST 2 STDS TO BOTTOM
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|DRL 1 DRILL F/11155' TO 11162' WOB 45, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
3/27/2007  [06:00 - 10:30 450/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11155' TO 11190', WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
11:00 - 12:00 100/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11190' TO 11195, WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE PUMP ROD & SWAB # 1 MUD PUMP
12:30 - 18:30 6.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11195’ TO 11244', WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
18:30 - 19:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB # 1 PUMP
19:30 - 20:00 050/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11244' TO 11246, WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
20:00 - 21:00 1.00|SUR |1 DROP SURVEY
21:00 - 22:00 100/ TRP 10 TOOH W/ BIT # 13, ROTATE & PUMP FIRST 2 STANDS, PUMP DRY SLUG
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT PIPE SPINNERS
23:00 - 03:30 450/ TRP |10 FINISH TOOH
03:30 - 06:00 250 TRP {10 TIH W/ BIT # 14
3/28/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 6 CUT DRILL LINE
07:00 - 09:30 250/ TRP (10 TIH TO 11190"
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM TO 11246', PUMP SWEEP & CLEAN BOTTOM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location: ‘)’7/ 36 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: " UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:dbe Description of Operations
3/28/2007  [10:30 - 16:30 6.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11246' TO11306', WOB 22-26, ROT 30, PS 90, PP 2350 (HIGH TORQUE,
STALLING TOP DRIVE & MUD MOTOR)
16:30 - 17:30 1.00{SUR |1 CIRCULATE & DROP SURVEY
17:30 - 18:30 1.00| TRP {12 TOOH, ROTATE & PUMP OUT FIRST 2 STANDS, PULL 5 STANDS
18:30 - 19:00 0.50|CIRC {1 PUMP DRY SLUG
19:00 - 23:30 450|TRP |12 TOOH W/ BIT # 14
23:30 - 00:30 1.00{TRP |1 CHANGE OUT STABILIZED MUD MOTOR W/ SLICK MUD MOTOR. RERUN BIT #
14
00:30 - 05:30 5.00| TRP {12 TIH W/ BIT # 15
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| REAM {1 WASH & REAM TO 11306', PUMP SWEEP & CLEAN BOTTOM
3/29/2007 | 06:00 - 13:00 7.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11306’ TO 11474, WOB 28-30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2600 (HIGH
TORQUE)
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:30-06:00 | 16.50| DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11474' TO 11756', WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 200, PP 2300 (HIGH TORQUE
SOMETIMES STALLING TOP DRIVE)
3/30/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 2.00| OTH TOTAL TIME WORKING PIPE F/ STALLED MUD MOTOR
08:00 - 09:00 1.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11756' TO 11772, WOB 26, PS 200, PP 2350 (HIGH TORQUE)
09:00 - 09:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE VALVE CAP & GASKET # 1 PUMP
09:30 - 10:30 1.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11772 TO 11777', WOB 20-24, PS 200, PP 2350 (UNABLE TO ADD
MORE WIGHT STALLING MUD MOTOR})
10:30 - 11:30 1.00{SUR 1 CIRCULATE & DROP SURVEY
11:30 - 20:00 850/ TRP |12 TOOH W/ BIT # 15, PUMP & ROTATE 7 STANDS OFF BOTTOM
20:00 - 22:00 2.00| OTH RETRIEVE SURVEY, CHANGE OUT MUD MOTOR & BIT
22:00 - 04:30 6.50| TRP |2 TIH W/ BIT # 16 TO 11658'
04:30 - 05:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM TO 11777' (PRECAUTIONARY)
05:00 - 06:00 1.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11777 TO 11787', WOB 14, ROT 25, PS 200, PP 2700
3/31/2007  |06:00 - 07:30 150{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11787' TO 11827° WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2400
07:30 - 08:00 0.50|DRL |1 REPAIR WASHED VALVE CAP SEAT & REPLACE GASKET
08:00 - 09:00 1.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11827' TO 11846, WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2400
09:00 - 09:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
09:30-22:00 | 12.50(DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11846' TO 12039, WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2200
22:00 - 22:30 0.50{ OTH AIR OUT PUMPS
22:30 - 01:00 250|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 12039' TO 12068, WOB 20-24, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2200 (MUD MOTOR
STALLING W/ 22-24K ON BIT)
01:00 - 03:00 2.00/CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & PUMP SWEEP
03:00 - 04:30 1.50| OTH SAFETY MEETING. PUMP DOWN GYRODATA TOOL
04:30 - 06:00 150|{ TRP |2 TOOH W/ GYRODATA TOOL
4/1/2007 06:00 - 13:30 750|TRP |2 TOOH W/ GYRODATA TOOL, PUMP & ROTATE 9 STANDS OFF BOTTOM
13:30 - 16:30 3.00{ OTH RETRIEVE GYRO TOOL, BREAK BIT & CHANGE OUT MUD MOTORS
(PROBLEMS DOWNLOADING DATA F/ TOOL TO COMPUTER, AFTER DOWN
LOADING GYRODATA TECH DID BATTERY CHECK LOOSING ALL DATA)
16:30 - 18:00 150 TRP |2 TIH TO CSG SHOE Wi BIT # 17
18:00 - 19:30 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE
19:30 - 20:30 100|TRP |2 TIH TO 6509' (TIGHT)
20:30 - 22:00 1.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 6509' TO 6622'
22:00 - 00:00 200/ TRP |2 TIH TO 10882
00:00 - 00:30 0.50| OTH INSTALL NEW ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
00:30 - 01:30 1.00{TRP |2 TIH TO 11933’
01:30 - 02:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 11933 TO 12022' (PRECAUTIONARY)
02:00 - 02:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB & ROD WASHER # 2 MUD PUMP
02:30 - 03:00 0.50/ REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 12022' TO 12068' (PRECAUTIONARY)
03:00 - 06:00 3.00/DRL |1 DRILL £/ 12068' TO 12121, WOB 20, ROT 20, PS 170, PP 1850
4/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, CHANGE GRABBER DIE ON TOP DRIVE, ATTEMPT TO
i
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 7) 36~ 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code g:dbe Description of Operations
4/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| RIG 1 CALIBRATE BIT WIGHT ON PASON. CALLED PASON
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB # 1 PUMP
08:00-18:00 | 10.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 12121' TO 12237', WOB 28-30, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 1950 (HIGH
TORQUE)
£18:00 - 23:00 5.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 12237 TO 12277', WOB 20-25, ROT 35, PS 190, PP 2150 (HIGH
TORQUE, STALLING MUD MOTOR)
23:00 - 00:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB # 2 PUMP
00:00 - 02:30 250/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 12277' TO 12301, WOB 20-22, ROT 30, PS 190, PP 2150 (STALLING
MUD MOTOR)
02:30 - 03:30 1.00{SUR |1 CIRCULATE & DROP SURVEY
03:30 - 06:00 250|TRP |12 TOOH W/ BIT # 17 (ROTATE & PUMP 10 STANDS OFF BOTTOM, PULLED
TIGHT @ 11820' TO 11750, SPOT WEIGHTED PILL)
4/3/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50| TRP  [12 TOOH, PUMP & ROTATE STAND # 10 DRILL STRING PARTED 75' BELOW
ROTARY FLOOR (PIN END WHERE TUBE FRICTION WELDED TO TOOL JOINT
BROKE)
06:30 - 13:00 6.50| WOT |4 WAIT ON FISHING TOOLS
13:00 - 15:00 200|FISH |5 MAKE UP OVERSHOT & BUMPER SUB TIH TO 1006' TAG FISH, ENGAGE FISH,
PULL 1000004, FISH STRIING WEIGHT 250000#
15:00 - 17:00 200(FISH |5 TOOH TO OVERSHOT & FISH, DISENGAGE FISH, HIGH DRAG IN CASING
17:00 - 01:00 8.00/FISH |5 TOOH LAYING DOWN 4-1/2" DROPPED DRILL PIPE (105.5 JOINTS - 3322'
RECOVERED) TOP OF FISH 4-1/2" DP TUBE W/ DIMINSION OF 5-3/4" x 2-3/4"
@ 4328 (CASING SHOE @ 4267)
01:00 - 04:00 3.00[FISH |5 REARRANGE DRILL PIPE ON LOCATION, LAY OUT & STRAP 3-1/2" DP (WAIT
ON LONG SKIRTED MiLL)
04:00 - 06:00 2.00/FISH |5 P/ 3-1/2" DRILL PIPE
4/4/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00/FISH |5 FINISH P/U 108 JTS 3-1/2" DP
09:00 - 10:00 1.00| OTH RIG DOWN FRANKS LAY DOWN TRUCK
10:00 - 11:30 150|TRP |2 TOOH STAND BACK 33 STANDS 3-1/2" DP
11:30 - 13:00 150|TRP  [1 P/U & M/U MILL, BUMPER SUB, JAR, 3 EA 6-1/2" DC & ENERGIZER
13:00 - 14:00 1.00|TRP |2 TIH W/ FISHING ASSEMBLY TO 1346'
14:00 - 15:00 1.00| OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB TO 3-1/2" IF & RESET TORQUE
15:00 - 16:30 150/ TRP |2 TIH TO 4288’
16:30 - 17:00 0.50/FISH |2 WASH DOWN OVER TOP OF FISH F/ 4288' TO 4292
17:00-06:00 | 13.00{FISH |1 MILL ON FISH F/ 4292 TO 4294'
4/5/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50|FISH 1 MILL ON FISH F/ 4294' TO 4295.6' (RECOVER TOTAL 3.2 LB METALCUTTINGS)
12:30 - 15:00 250[TRP |2 TOOH W/ SKIRTED MILL (5.5 INCHS WORE OFF MILL SKIRT & 4 INCHES
CUTRITE INSIDE WORE OFF)
15:00 - 17:00 200 OTH L/D FISHING TOOLS, STRAP 4" XT39 $135 - 14# DP, CHANGE OUT
ELEVATORS & SLIPS
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| OTH R/U FRANKS LAY DOWN TRUCK & HOLD SAFETY MEETING
18:00 - 22:00 4.00|OTH P/U 4" DRILL PIPE - 105 JTS
22:00 - 22:30 0.50| OTH R/D LAY DOWN TRUCK
22:30 - 00:00 1.50| OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB & RESET TORQUE
00:00 - 01:30 150/ TRP |2 TOOH STANDING BACK 35 STANDS 4" DP
01:30 - 02:30 1.00{ OTH CHANGE ELEVATORS & M/U MILL, BIT SUB, BUMPER SUB & JARS
02:30 - 06:00 350/TRP |2 TIH W/ 5 BLADED 8-1/2" MILL
4/6/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |2 FINISH TIH W/ 5 BLADED MILL, TAG @ 4286'
07:00-22:00 | 15.00|FISH |1 HIGH TORQUE F/ 4288 TO 4291'UNABLE TO MAINTAIN TORQUE, MILL DOWN
SIDE OF TUBE TO TOOL JT @ 4296.2', PICK UP TO 4280' & WORK DOWN F/
4288 TO 4291 W/ HIGH TORQUE. MILL UNTIL NO TORQUE.
22:00 - 02:30 450/ TRP |2 TOOH W/ MILL #2
02:30 - 03:00 0.50| OTH CHANGE OUT MILLS
03:00 - 06:00 300/ TRP |2 TIH W/ MILL # 3 - 5 BLADED 8-1/2"
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Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 3’ 36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name:" UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code C:Sc;Jdbe Description of Operations
4/7/2007 06:00- 16:30 | 10.50|FISH |1 MILL F/ 4296' TO 4298 BESIDE FISH, ATTEMPT TO MILL ON TOP OF FISH,
HIGH TORQUE THEN WALKING OFF FISH, TRYED LEAVING IN ONE PLACE @
4291.5' TO TRY AND START CUTTING GROOVE. MOST CONTACT W/ FISH
BETWEEN 4288' & 4292' THEN MILLING BESIDE.
16:30 - 19:00 250/ TRP |2 TOOH W/ MILL #3
19:00 - 20:30 1.50| OTH CHANGE OUT FISHING TOOLS
20:30 - 23:30 3.00|TRP |2 TIH W/ 8-5/8" KUTRITE WASHOVER SHOE W/ CONCAVE MILL TAG @ 4289’
23:30 - 06:00 6.50/ FISH |1 P/U & WORK DOWN, TAG LIP @ 4290' MILL W/ 2K, 75 RPM, 110 SPM, 390 PSI
4/8/2007 06:00 - 14:30 850/ FISH |1 MILL ON FISH @ 4290', ATTEMPT TO CUT 4-1/2" DP TUBE, MILL ROLLED OFF
LIP, UNABLE TO FIND GROOVE IN DP. WORK MILL FROM 4284' TO 4299', NO
TORQUE OR SET DOWN WEIGHT @ TOOL JOINT 4297'
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:00 - 17:30 250{TRP |2 TOOH W/ MILL # 4 & LAY DOWN
17:30 - 20:00 2.50| OTH CUT WALL HOOK ON BOTTOM OF # 4 MILL, M/U ON 1 JT DRILL PIPE, BEND +/-
1 DEGREE, P/ BUMPER SUB, JARS
20:00 - 22:00 200/ TRP |2 TIH W/ WASH PIPE SHOE & MILL #5
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| OTH WORK WALL HOOK SHOE OVER DP
23:00 - 04:30 550(FISH |1 MILL ON FISH Ff 4281.9" TO 4285.1' W/ 3-7K, ROT 65-70, PS 110, PP 390
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| TRP |2 TOOH W/ MILL #5
4/9/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50{TRP |2 FINISH TOOH W/ MILL # 5
07:30 - 08:30 1.00| OTH LAY DOWN MILL, TOP SUB. P/U 8-1/8" OVERSHOT DRESSED W/ 4-1/2"
GRAPPLES
08:30 - 11:00 250[TRP |2 TIH W/ OVERSHOT
11:00 - 11:30 0.50/ OTH ENGAGE FISH & BREAK CIRCULATION
11:30 - 13:30 2.00/CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & PULL STRETCH FROM DRILL STRING W/ 350K
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| OTH LAY DOWN 2 JTS DP, R/U CASED HOLE SOLUTIONS WIRELINE TRUCK
14:00 - 22:00 8.00|FISH |4 RIH W/ SINKER BAR OD 1-11/16', STOPPED 4620° WIRE LINE DEPTH.
ATTEMPT TO BACKOFF @ 4546' W/ 5 ROUNDS LEFT HAND TORQUE STRING
PARTED @ 1643'. SCREW INTO STRING, RETORQUE, ATTEPMT BACKOFF W/
4 ROUNDS LEFT TORQUE, SHOOT, NO SUCCESS. ATTEMPT BACKOFF W/ 5
ROUNDS LEFT TORQUE, SHOOT, NO SUCCESS. ATTEMPT BACKOFF W/ 6
ROUNDS LEFT TORQUE, STRING BACKEDOFF CONFIRMED W/ COLLAR
LOCATER @ 4546'
22:00 - 22:30 0.50|FISH |4 R/D WIRELINE TRUCK
22:30 - 02:00 350{TRP |2 TOOH W/ FISH
02:00 - 03:00 1.00| OTH LD 10 JTS DP &TOOL JTW/ 12" TUBE
03:00 - 03:30 0.50| OTH P/U SCREW IN SUB, BUMPER SUB, JAR
03:30 - 04:30 1.00{TRP |2 TIH W/ FISHING ASSY
04:30 - 05:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR AIR LINE TO CROWN-O-MATIC & RESET
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| TRP |2 TIH, RETORQUE EVERY CONNECTION
4/10/2007  {06:00 - 08:00 200{TRP |2 TRIP IN TO 4546' CIRCULATE AND SCREW INTO FISH
08:00-06:00 | 22.00(FISH |6 REGAIN CIRCULATION, FIRE FISHING JARS, NOT GAINING WHILE DOING
THIS, PULL 428,000 AND ROTATE LET TORQUE ZERO AND TRY AGAIN WORK
PIPE F/4556' TO 4530' ADD WALLNUT AND MICA
4/11/2007 | 06:00 - 09:30 3.50|FISH |6 WORK STUCK PIPE PULL 428000 TORQUE INTO PIPE NOT GAINNING LOSING
PUMP PRESSURE
09:30 - 11:00 150|CIRC |1 PULL 400000 INTO PIPE AND REDUCE PUMP RATE WAIT FOR LOGGING
TRUCK
11:00 - 12:30 1.50FISH |4 HELD SAFETY MEETING WITH LOGGERS, RIG UP LOGGERS, PULL 2" BLOW
PLUG ON GOOSE NECK FOR WIRE LINE ENTRY
12:30 - 20:00 750|FISH |4 FIRST RUN 20" SINKER BAR 1 11/16' OD WITH 10' JAR TO 8808, SECOND RUN
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 3] 36 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name:  UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code g:dbe Description of Operations
4/11/2007  |12:30 - 20:00 7.50|FISH !4 FREE POINT 1 5/8" OD TO 8808, FIND FREE POINT ON DRILL STRING, FREE
POINT 4813' WIRE LINE DEPTH
20:00 - 00:30 450|FISH 4 RUN IN BACK OFF TOOL PUT 4 TURNS OF LEFT HAND TORQUE IN PIPE AND
WORK IN FIRST SHOT DID NOT BACK OFF, RELOAD TOOL AND PUT 5 TURNS
OF LEFT HAND TORQUE IN PIPE AND WORK IN BACK OFF SUCCESSFULL
4813 280' OF FISH ANTICIPATED
00:30 - 01:00 0.50|FISH |4 RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK
01:00 - 05:00 400, TRP |2 TRIP OUT WITH FISH PULLED 320000 TO COME FREE
05:00 - 06:00 100 TRP |4 LAY DOWN FiSH, SCREEW IN SUB WASHED OUT AND FIRST TOOL JT FIRST
JT BENT BADLY
4/12/2007  |06:00 - 08:30 250|TRP |2 TRIP IN WITH SCREW IN SUB TO FISH
08:30 - 09:30 1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM 8 JTS TO FISH
09:30 - 15:30 6.00|FISH |6 SCREW INTO FISH BREAK CIRCULATION 10 PS 2000 PSI LET WELL CLEAN
AND START WORKING STUCK PIPE, NOT GAINING FIRING JARS, PULL
428000 AND PUT TORQUE IN PIPE PUMP SWEEP TO MAKE SURE WE ARE
CIRCULATING THROUGH BIT SAW SWEEP AT 11500 STROKES
15:30 - 18:30 3.00|FISH |4 RIG UP AND RUN FREE POINT FIRST JOINT BELOW FISH TOP 4813' WAS NOT
FREE, RIG DOWN WIRE LINE TRUCK
18:30 - 01:00 650|FISH |6 WORK STUCK PIPE, JARRING TO 330000, PUL INTO STRING 428000 AND PUT
TORQUE IN SET DOWN ON STRING TO 80000 NO GAIN
01:00 - 03:00 2.00|FISH |4 RIG UP WIRE LINE AND FREE POINT, HIT OBSTRUCTION IN DP AT 5265
LOGGER DEPTH FREE POINT 5255'
03:00 - 06:00 3.00|FISH |4 RUN BACK OFF TOOL TO FREE POINT 5255' AND BACK OFF
411312007 |06:00 - 09:00 300|TRP |2 TRIP OUT FISH #4 NOT TIGHT COMING OFF BOTTOM
09:00 - 10:30 150/ TRP |4 LAY DOWN 14 RECOVERED JTS OF DP SCREW IN SUB WASH OUT
10:30 - 12:30 2.00|WOT |4 WAIT ON SCREW IN SUB WITH OUT CIRCULATION PORT
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| OTH BOP FUNCTION TEST
13:00 - 17:00 400/ TRP |2 TRIP IN TO FISH TOP 5255' WASH LAST 8 STDS TO TOP
17:00 - 21:30 450|FISH |6 SCREW INTO FISH AT 5255' WORK STUCK PIPE UNABLE TO BREAK
CIRCULATION, JAR AND PULL 428000 AND ROTATE
21:30 - 01:30 4.00|FISH |4 RUN 30" 1 11/16" SINKER BAR TO 8810', RIG UP FREE POINT AND RUN IN
PIPE STUCK AT 4851' FREE POINT 4817'
01:30 - 05:00 3.50|FISH 4 RIG UP PERFORATING GUNS 12 .25" HOLES TOP 8758' BOTTOM 8761'
LOGGER DEPTH
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|FISH 6 SCREW IN BLOW PLUG ON BONNET AND BREAK CIRCULATION WORK
STUCK PIPE HARD TO BREAK CIRCULATION 25 STROKES 2000 PSI
4/14/2007  |06:00 - 12:30 6.50/FISH |6 WORK STUCK PIPE,, JAR, PULL 428000 AND PUT TORQUE IN NOT GAINING
LOT OF SAND COMING OVER SHAKERS WHILE CIRCULATING
12:30 - 16:00 350{FISH 14 RIG UP AND RUN FREE POINT FOUND FREE POINT AT 7495' LOGGER DEPTH
16:00 - 18:00 2.00[FISH |5 RIG UP AND RUN BACKOFF TOOL, WORK TORQUE IN PIPE AND BACK OFF
AT 7495' LOGGER DEPTH
18:00 - 19:30 1.50{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE TO CLEAN HOLE SAND COMING OVER SHAKERS
19:30 - 22:00 250/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT THE FISHING STRING TO 4 1/2" DP
22:00 - 03:30 550{TRP 4 LAY DOWN 30 JTS OF 4 1/2" DP THEN LAY DOWN FISH #6, 72 JTS BENT
03:30 - 05:30 200{TRP 12 TRIP IN 3 1/2" HT38 OUT OF DERRICK
05:30 - 06:00 050/ TRP |3 LAY DOWN 3 1/2" DP
4/15/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 200/TRP I3 LAY DOWN 3 1/2" HT-38 DRILL PIPE
08:00 - 08:30 0.50[ TRP i1 MAKE UP FISHING TOOLS
08:30 - 09:00 050[{OTH ! RIG DOWN LAY DOWN MACHINE
09:00 - 11:30 250{TRP 12 TRIP IN 4" DRILL PIPE STRAP IN
11:30 - 12:30 1.00{OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB
12:30 - 13:00 050{OTH RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE
13:00 - 22:00 9.00]TRP 2 PICK UP 128 JTS OF 5" DRILL PIPE CIRCULATE THEM DOWN 4650' TO 4900'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 2j 36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: "UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:dbe Description of Operations
41512007 |13:00 - 22:00 900{TRP 2 CIRCULATE ABOVE FISH
22:00 - 23:30 150/ CIRC 11 SCREW INTO FISH, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION WOULD NOT CIRCULATE
WORK PIPE AND FEATHER PUMP
23:30 - 05:00 550|FISH |6 WORK STUCK PIPE, FIRE JARS AT 340000, PULL 490000 AN D TORQUE INTO
PIPE, BUILD MUD VOLUME, FULL CIRCULATION
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|FISH |4 PULL BLOW PLUG ON GOOSE NECK AND RIG UP WIRE LINE TRUCK
4/16/2007 | 06:00 - 13:00 7.00|FISH |4 FREE POINT, UNABLE TO PASS BY 8810’ RIG UP BACK OFF TOOL CHANGE
ROPE SOCKET FOR SHORTER TOOL SO IT WOULD PASS 8810' GOT TO 8835'
WITH TOOL, WORK IN TORQUE TO BACK OFF AND IT BACK OFF MANUALLY
ABOVE DC SCREW BACK IN AND WORK TORQUE IN
13:00 - 14:00 1.00|FISH |6 WORK STUCK PIPE CIRCULATE WORK TORQUE BACK INTO STRING
14:00 - 16:30 2.50|FISH |4 RUN BACK OFF TOOL TO 8832' AND BACK OFF
16:30 - 17:00 0.50{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT
17:00 - 22:00 5.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT WITH FISH #7
22:00 - 23:00 1.00{OTH . RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK
23:00 - 01:00 2.00{TRP  [4 LAY DOWN FISH #7 42 JTS LAST 5 JTS BADLY BENT
01:00 - 02:30 150 TRP 1 PICK UP FISHING TOOLS
02:30 - 03:00 050/ TRP ;2 PICK UP 15 JTS OF 4" DRILL PIPE
03:00 - 03:30 0.50| OTH RIG DOWN LAY DOWN MACHINE
03:30 - 05:30 2.00|TRP {2 TRIP IN TO HOLE TO SHOE
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| RIG 6 SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE
4/17/2007  |06:00 - 09:30 350|TRP |2 TRIP INTO TOP OF FISH AT 8832'
09:30 - 11:00 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT
11:00 - 13:00 2.00|FISH |6 TRY TO BREAK CIRCULATION COULD NOT, JAR AT 420000 AFTER JARS
FIRED PULL INTO PIPE 490000
13:00 - 18:30 550|FISH |4 RIG UP WIRE LINE, GO IN WITH SINKER BARS TO 10736', PICK UP FREE
POINT TOOL FREE POINT AT 10717'
18:30 - 22:00 350|FISH |4 RUN BACK OFF TOOL TO 10717' WORK TORQUE INTO PIPE, PIPE BACKED
OFF ABOVE DC SCREW BACK IN AND WORK TORQUE INTO PIPE
22:00 - 01:00 3.00|FISH |4 RUN BACK OFF TOOL AGAIN TO 10717 WORK TORQUE INTO STRING
BACKED OFF AT 10717' LOGGER DEPTH
01:00 - 03:30 250/ CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT GAS AT 5221 UNITS
03:30 - 06:00 250|TRP |2 TRIP OUT FISH #8
4/18/2007 | 06:00 - 08:30 250/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT WITH FISH #8 TO DC
08:30 - 10:00 1.50{ OTH RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK
10:00 - 13:30 350/ TRP |4 LAY DOWN DC AND 60 JTS OF FISH PIPE BENT
13:30 - 14:30 1.00|TRP |1 PICK UP BHA CHANGE OUT SCREW IN SUB, CHANGE LAY DOWN TRAUPH
TO OTHER SIDE OF CAT WALK
14:30 - 18:30 400|TRP |2 PICK UP 20 JTS OF 4 1/2" HWDP AND 48 JTS OF 4" DP
18:30 - 19:00 0.50| OTH RIG DOWN LAY DOWN MACHINE
19:00 - 23:30 450|TRP |2 TRIP IN OUT OF DERRICK
23:30 - 01:00 160[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT
01:00 - 03:00 2.00/FISH |6 SCREW INTO FISH AT 10717* WORK STUCK PIPE NO CIRCULATION, JAR AT
420000, AND PULL INTO STRING TO 490000 TORQUE INTO PIPE
03:00 - 06:00 3.00/FISH |4 RIG UP AND RUN SINKER BAR
4/19/2007  |06:00-06:00 | 24.00|FISH |4 CLEAR OBSTRUCTION FROM ID OF HWDP STARTED AT 10967' GO IN WITH 1
3/8" CORE TUBE WITH SINKER BARS AND HAMMER UNTIL WE DID NOT GAIN
ANY MORE THAN PICK UP 3/4" SUCKER BAR 4' LONG AND HAMMER
STARTED AT 10967' NOW WE ARE AT 11034’ CORE BARREL RECOVERS
ABOUT ONE FOOT EACH RUN
4/20/2007  |06:00- 11:30 550|FISH |4 RUN IN FREE POINT TOOL, FREE POINT 10898', RIG UP AND RUN BACK OFF
TOOL, BACK FISH OFF AT 10898'
OTH RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK AND PUT 2" BLOW PLUG IN GOOSE NECK

11:30- 12:00 0.50
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:g/ 36-14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code gg’dbe Description of Operations
4/20/2007  |12:00 - 14:00 200! CIRC 11 CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND CLEAN WELLBORE
14:00 - 21:00 7.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT FISH #9
21:00 - 22:00 1.00| OTH RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| TRP |3 LAY DOWN 20 JTS OF 4 1/2" HWDP
23:00 - 00:00 1.00| TRP |4 LAY DOWN FISH #9 1 JT OF 4.5 DP AND 5 JTS OF HWDP BENT
100:00 - 01:00 1.00| OTH PUT 14 JTS OF 4 15/16" DC ON RACKS AND 4" HWDP STRAP
01:00 - 06:00 500|{TRP |1 PICK UP BHA, 8 1/2" TRI-CONE, BIT SUB, XO, 14 DC, 20 HWDP, JARS, 15
HWDP
4/21/2007  |06:00 - 06:30 050/ TRP |2 PICK UP 4" DP
06:30 - 07:00 0.50| OTH RIG DOWN LAY DOWN TRUCK
07:00 - 09:30 250|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 4600
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| OTH CHANGE SAVER SUB TO XT-39
10:00-22:00 | 12.00] REAM |1 REAM BRIDGE AT 4600' AND THROUGH BUILD SECTION TO 5700 AT 8600’
CIRCULATE AND WORK HOLE UNTIL IT CLEANED UP, FINISH TRIP IN
! WASHED LAST 11 STDS TO BOTTOM FISH TOP BY STRAP 10876'
|22:00 - 03:00 5.00(CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND WORK PIPE LARGE AMOUNTS OF SAND CIRCULATE UNTIL
| IT CLEANED UP MIX FRESH GELL
103:00 - 06:00 3.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO PICK UP CEMENT STINGER 50000 TO 60000 OVER PULL
4/22/2007  $06:00 - 10:30 450/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO PICK UP CEMENT STINGER
{10:30 - 11:00 050/ TRP |1 LAY DOWN BIT AND BIT SUB, PICK UP CEMENT STINGER FOUR 1/2" PERFS
‘ FIVE FOOT OF PERFS TOOL 24' DOWN TO TOP OF PERFS
11:00 - 17:00 6.00| TRP |2 TRIP INTO HOLE TO PLUG BACK
17:00 - 19:30 250/ CIRC {1 CIRCULATE, BOTTOM OF TOOL AT 10873
19:30 - 20:30 1.00{CMT |2 CEMENT WITH HALLIBURTON, PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 3500 PSI, PUMP 20
BBLS OF WATER PREFLUSH, 320 SACKS OF 17.5 PPG 53.5 BBLS OF CLASS G
CEMENT, 2.3 BBLS WATER, DISPLACED WITH 118 BBLS OF WATER FULL
RETURNS DURRING JOB PLUG DOWN 20:16
20:30 - 21:30 1.00|TRP |2 PULL 10 STDS
21:30- 23:30 200{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE WELL BORE CLEAN
23:30 - 04:00 450/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT LAY DOWN STINGER
04:00 - 04:30 0.50] OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
04:30 - 06:00 150|BOP |2 RIG UP BOP TEST TRUCK AND TEST
4/23/12007 | 06:00 - 12:30 6.50BOP 12 TEST BOP, BLINDS, PIPES, CHOKE LINE, CHOKE, FLOOR VALVES AND KELLY
VALVE 250 LOW AND 5000 HIGH, BAG AND STAND PIPE 250 LOW AND 3500
HIGH ALL TESTED GOOD
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
13:00 - 15:30 250(TRP |1 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND ORIENT MOTOR IS .25 RPG SET AT 1.50
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:00 - 21:30 550(TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 10122'
21:30 - 22:30 1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM TO CEMENT TOP AT 10325'
22:30 - 23:00 0.50{DRL |1 DRILL CEMENT F/10325' TO 10351’ KICK OFF POINT
23:00 - 06:00 700{DRL |2 SLIDE FROM 10351’ TO 10368’ TIME DRILL THEN ADD WEIGHT TO KICK OFF
4/24/2007  |06:00-21:00 | 1500/DRL |7 SLIDE TO SIDE TRACK 10368' TO 10436' ATTEMPT TO TIME DRILL WEIGHT
WOULD STACK IN DRILL STRING AND RELEASE CAUSING LOSS OF TOOL
FACE, ATTEMPT HEAVY WEIGHT TO PUSH BEND, DISABLE PUMP, AT 10426'
WORK IN TROUGH AND THEN TRY TO SIDE TRACK WITH LIGHTEST WEIGHT
POSSIBLE SAMPLES SHOWED 50% SHALE AND 50% CEMENT THIS WENT
BACK TO 90% CEMENT
21:00 - 21:30 0.50| CIRC |1 PUMP WEIGHTED PILL
21:30 - 02:30 500|TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO SET MOTOR UP TO 1.85
02:30 - 03:00 0.50| OTH ADJUST MOTOR FROM 1.5 TO 1.85
03:00 - 04:30 1.50| TRP |2 TRIP INTO SHOE
04:30 - 06:00 1.50|RIG |6 SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location: 3 ‘ 38-14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: "UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To { Hours | Code géldbe Description of Operations
4/25/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00| TRP |2 FINISH TRIP IN i
09:00 - 11:00 200/DRL |7 ATTEMPT TO SIDE TRACK, 10436' TO 10451' PUT 16000 WOB WOULD SEE

SLIGHT DIF TIME DRILL UNTIL WOB HIT 30000 AND ROCK DRILL STRING
SMAPLES 95% CEMENT

11:00-11:30 0.50{ RIG 1 RIG SERVICE

11:30 - 21:.00 9.50 SIDETRACK 10451’ TO 10466' 16000 WOB TIME DRILL ADD 1 INCH EVERY 2
MINUTES WHEN WAIT STACKED TO 30000 WORK HOLE INSTEAD OF
ROCKING SAMPLES 40% SHALE AND 60% CEMENT 10466

21:00-21:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB IN #2 PUMP
21:30 - 06:00 8.50| DRL 7 SIDETRACK 10466' TO 10475' 16000 WOB TIME DRILL ADD 1 INCH EVERY 2
MINUTES WHEN WAIT STACKED TO 30000 WORK HOLE SAMPLES ALL
CEMENT
4/26/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50| DRL 7 SIDETRACK 10475' TO 10478', 16K WOB, TIME DRILL W/ 1 INCH EVERY 2 MIN.
WHEN WEIGHT STACKED TO 30K WORK HOLE. SAMPLES: 15% FORMATION
11:30-12:30 1.00| CIRC 1 CIRCULATE, MIX & PUMP DRY SLUG
12:30 - 19:00 6.50| TRP 10 TOOH W/ BIT #20
19:00 - 19:30 0.50| OTH CHANGE BITS
19:30 - 00:00 4.50| TRP 10 TIH W/ BIT #21 & BREAK CIRCULATION
00:00 - 06:00 6.00; DRL 7 BUILD TROUGH F/ 10450' TO 10473', WOB 8-12K
4/27/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
06:30 - 08:00 1.50} DRL 7 SIDETRACK,CONTINUE BUILD TROUGH TO 10473
08:00 - 16:30 8.50| DRL 7 SIDETRACK F/ 10472- 10480 ADD 50K WT. FELL OFF TO 28K WITH NO

DIFFERENTIAL 40% -60% SHALE ON RETURNS

16:30 - 18:00 150|CIRC |5 CIRC SAMPLES F/ SIDETRACK

18:00 - 18:30 1.50| DRL 7 SIDE TRACK F/ 10480° TO 10487", TIME DRILL 5 MIN PER INCH ADD WT. 20K
UNABLE TO SUSTAIN WT. ON BIT FELL OFF TO NO DIFFERENTIAL 90%
CEMENT 10% SHALE ON RETURNS

19:30 - 20:30 1.00| CIRC CIRCULATE & SURVEY

20:30 - 23:30 3.00| DRL 7 SIDE TRACK F/ 10487' TO 10490° 1MIN PER INCH 8-10K WT ON BIT WITH
25 PS1 OF DIFFERENTIAL 80% CEMENT 20% SHALE ON RETURNS

-

23:30 - 06:00 6.50| DRL 7 SIDE TRACK BUILDING TROUGH F/ 10458’ TO 10478'
4/28/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00{ DRL 7 FINISH BUILDING TROUGH F/ 10458- 10478
07:00 - 06:00 23.00| DRL 7 SIDETRACK TIME DRILL 5MIN PER INCH £/10477-10490 INCREASE SPEED
4MIN PER INCH 10490-10495 INCRESE 3MIN PER INCH 10495-10500
INCRESE 2MIN PER INCH 10500-10505 1MIN PER INCH 10505 TO 10507
- NOTE @ 10491 SAMPLES FELL FROM 85% SHALE 15% CEMENT TO 60%
SHALE / 40% CEMENT
4/29/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50| DRL 7 TIME DRILL 1MIN PER INCH F/10507-10521 RETURNS GOOD
08:30 - 09:00 0.50{ RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
09:00 - 14:00 5.00| DRL 7 TIME DRILL 1MIN PER INCH F/10521-10546 SHALE 80% CEMENT 20%
14.00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 2 SERVICE TOP DRIVE CHANGE O-RING
14:30 - 16:00 1.50| DRL 1 START ROTATING F/10546-10566 10-15K WOB
16:00 - 16:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB 1 # PUMP
16:30 - 20:00 3.50| DRL 1 ROTATING 10566-10610
20:00 - 20:30 0.50] RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB 1 #PUMP
20:30 - 06:00 9.50| DRL 1 DRLG S/F 10610-10632 R/F 10632-10642 S/F10642-10650 R/F 10650-10673
S/F 10673-10681 R/F10681-
4/30/2007 06:00 - 15:30 9.50| DRL 1 DRLG F/10705-10833
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:00 - 17:30 1.50, DRL 1 DRLG F/10833-10855 MUD MOTOR PRESSURE SPIKED
17:30- 18:30 1.00{ CIRC 1 CIRC BOTTOM UP /FOR TRIPS
18:30 - 20:00 1.50| TRP 10 BACK REAM 4 STS W/TOP DRIVE / MIX/ PUMP PILL
20:00 - 02:00 6.00| TRP 10 TOOH W ITH BIT 21#
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 3| 36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code (Esgldbe Description of Operations
4/30/2007  |02:00 - 03:30 150 TRP |1 L/D MUD MOTOR /BIT P/U MUD MOTOR /BIT 22# ORIENT MWD /DIRECTIONAL
TOOLS
03:30 - 06:00 250|RIG |2 REPAIR BROKE DRIVE DRAW WORKS /CHAIN
5/1/2007 06:00 - 08:00 200|RIG |2 REPAIR DRAW WORKS CHAIN
08:00 - 09:30 150/ TRP |10 |TIH TO SHOE
09:30 - 11:00 150{RIG |6 CUT 780' BAD DRILLING LINE / CHECK BRAKES
14:00 - 14:30 350[ TRP |10  |TIH T/10737
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| REAM |1 SAFETY WASH & REAM F/10737-10855 NO FILL
15:00-03:00 | 12.00{DRL (1 DRLG 10855 - 11072 ROTATING / SURVEY/SLIDES
03:00 - 03:30 0.50| RIG 1 REPAIR LEAK ON STAND PIPE
03:30 - 06:00 250|DRL |1 DRLG 11072-11105 WOB 20K, ROT 30, PS 150, PP 2380
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT 1/3-077._ 3 8772 Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSc;jc;)e Description of Operations
2/8/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 RIG DOWN 60% RIG MOVE 5%
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: WILL LOWER DERRICK THIS MORNING, TOP DRIVE & POWER UNIT
TRUCKED TO GRAND JUNCTION, COLO FOR REPAIRS
2/9/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 RIG DOWN 65% - RIG MOVE 15% (TOTAL 8 HAUL TRUCKS, 2 BED TRUCKS, 2
CRANES, 1 LOADER - BLACKHILLS)
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: RIG MOVE 90 MILES ONE WAY, ROAD CONDITIONS BAD
APPROXIMATELY 70 MILES DUE TO THAW. 9 HOURS ROUND TRIP TRUCK.
2/10/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC (4 80% RIG DOWN - 20% MOVE (1 TRAILER DOWN BRAKES, 1 TRUCK DOWN
FAN BELT, 1 TRUCK REBUILDING MUD CHAINS) 4 LOADS TODAY
18:00- 06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
- NOTE: 1 MORE HAUL TRUCK THIS AM, 2 GIN TRUCKS TODAY, 1 HAUL TRUCK
TOMORROW
2111/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 RIG DOWN 95% RIG MOVE 30 % (8 LOADS OFF LOCATION WILL SET
MATTING BOARDS & SUB TODAY ON 7P LOCATION. ESTIMATE MOVE CAMP
TUES. 13TH)
18:00-06:00 {  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT (RAIN PM)
- NOTE: 1 TRUCK & TRAILER REPAIRED, 3 MORE TRUCKS ON LOCATION
TODAY
21122007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 RIG DOWN 95% (CAMP LEFT TO RIG DOWN, WILL MOVE TUES 13TH) RIG
MOVE 40% (6 LOADS) RIG UP 5% (SET MATTING BOARDS & LOWER
SUBSTRUCTURE)
18:00-06:00 |  12.00{ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/13/2007  06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |3 RIG DOWN 95% WILL RIG DOWN CAMPS TODAY RIG MOVE 65% 6 BIG LOADS
AND TUBULARS LEFT ON LOCATION, SUB BASE IN PLACE ON 7P, TRUCKS
GETTING STUCK ON MAIN ROAD WILL HAVE BLADES HELP WITH RIG MOVE
TODAY
18:00-06:00 | 12.00/LOC |3 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
21412007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 MOVE § CAMPS FROM FR 11 TO FR3 RIG MOVE 70%, RIG UP 5%
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/15/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 RIG UP CAMPS, SET IN DRAWWORKS, FLOOR MOTORS AND TOP DOG
HOUSE, RIG MOVE 75%, RIG UP 10%
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/16/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 SET IN SHALE SHAKERS, GAS BUSTER, MUD CLEANER AND #2 PUMP
DERRICK HALF PINNED TOGHETHER, TUBULARS AND MUD, FLARE BOW
AND BOUYE AND FLARE LINES LEFT TO MOVE FROM 11P
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2117/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 RIG 85% MOVED, RIG UP 30%, SET MUD PUMPS AND MUD TANKS FINISH
PINNING DERRICK TOGHETHER
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
21182007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 PIN IN DERRICK, SET IN SUIT CASES AND OUT BUILDINGS AND REMIANING
SHACKS RIG 90% RIG UP 60%
18:00- 06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/19/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 HOOK UP AIR, STEAM, WATER AND FUEL LINES SET DEER STANDS RIG UP
75%, RIG MOVE 95% EVERYTHING IS OFF FR11P, WILL WELD WELLHEAD ON
TODAY AND STRING BLOCKS, RAISE DERRICK
2/20/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 STRING BLOCKS AND RAISE DERRICK, WELD ON WELLHEAD, SET IN AIR
PACKAGE AND MUD, GENERAL RIG UP. WILL SET TOP DRIVE UNIT AND RIG
UP 2/20, NIPPLE UP AND PRESSURE TEST 2/21 DRILL 2/22. RIG MOVE 100%,
RIG UP 80%
18:00-06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/21/2007 1200/LOC |4 BRIDLE DOWN, HYDROMATIC FROZE HAD TO THAW OUT FOR BLOCKS TO

06:00 - 18:00
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code g:dbe Description of Operations
2/21/2007  |06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 MOVE, IN STALL TORQUE TUBE AND RIG UP FLOOR, FIRE BOILER AND
CHECK FOR LEAKS, RUN AIR COMPRESSORS, RIG UP 90% WILL FINISH
RIGGING UP TOP DRIVE AND NIPPLE UP 2/21
18:00-06:00 | 12,00/ OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
2/22/2007  |06:00- 18:00 |  12.00| OTH RIG UP TOP DRIVE
18:00-05:00 | 11.00/BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOP
05:00 - 06:00 100|BOP |2 TEST BOP 250 LOW AND 5000 HUGH, STAND PIPE AND BAG TO 250 LOW
AND 5000 HIGH
2/23/2007  |06:00 - 11:30 550(BOP |2 TEST BOP, LOWER PIPES, BLINDS, UPPER PIPES, KELLY COCK, HCR,
CHOKE MANNIFOLD AND FLOOR VALVES 5000 HIGH AND 250 LOW, STAND
PIPE AND BAG 3500 HIGH AND 250 LOW ALL TESTED OK
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| OTH SET WEAR BUSHING
12:00 - 18:00 6.00| OTH REFABRICATE BUOYE LINE AND STRING FLARE LINE AND PANIC LINE
18:00 - 19:00 1.00| OTH DRILL AND SET MOUSEHOLE
19:00 - 20:00 1.00|TRP |1 MAKE UP BHA
20:00 - 20:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR SERVICE LOOP ON TOP DRIVE
20:30 - 02:00 550/ TRP |1 PICK UP BHA
02:00 - 03:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE 10" VALVE ON FLOW LINE
03:00 - 06:00 3.00(DRL |4 DRILL CEMENT TAG @ 468' DRILL CEMENT TO 530'
2/24/2007  |06:00 - 08:00 200[DRL |1 DRILL F/548' TO 680' WOB 15,ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 190
08:00 - 08:30 050/SUR |1 SURVEY @ 655'.6 INC 293.98 AZM
08:30 - 14:00 550/DRL |1 DRILL F/680' TO 1044’ WOB 25, ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6GPM, PP 230
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
14:30 - 15:30 1.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/1044' TO 1137 WOB 25, ROT 70, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 230
15:30 - 16:00 0.50/SUR |1 SURVEY @ 1129' .8 INC 318.18 AZM
16:00 - 23:30 750/DRL |1 DRILL F/1137' TO 1594' WOB 30, ROT 65, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 255
23:30 - 00:00 0.50/SUR |1 SURVEY @ 1570' .8 INC 323.38 AZM
00:00 - 06:00 6.00{|DRL |1 DRILL F/1594' TO 1967' WOB 30, ROT 65, AIR 2800, MIST 6 GPM, PP 310
MAKING VERY LITTLE WATER
21252007  |06:00 - 07:45 175|DRL |1 DRILL F/1967' TO 2062' WOB 35, ROT 85, AIR 2800 CFM, PP 310 MAKING VERY
LITTLE WATER
07:45 - 08:15 050[SUR |1 SURVEY @ 2054' 1.4 INC 350.38 AZM
08:15 - 12:00 3.75|DRL 11 DRILL F/2062' TO 2249’ WOB 35, ROT 60, 2800 CFM, 6 GPM, PP 314 WATER
PICKING UP FROM HOLE
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:30 - 16:00 350[DRL |1 DRILL F/2249' TO 2457' WOB 35, ROT 60, 2800 CFM, 6 GPM, PP 410 MAKING
WATER
16:00 - 20:00 400|TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO PICK UP DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS, LAY DOWN IBS AND BIT SUB
20:00 - 22:00 2.00| RIG 2 CHANGE ACCUATOR VALVE ON TOP DRIVE
22:00 - 01:00 3.00/TRP |1 PICK UP DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS AND ORIENT
01:00 - 04:30 350[TRP |2 TRIP IN, TEST MWD AT 650"
04:30 - 05:00 0.50| REAM |1 BREAK CIRCULATION, WASH & REAM LAST STD TO BOTTOM
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 PUMP
2/26/2007  |06:00 - 06:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE CAP GASKET ON #1 PUMP
06:30 - 08:00 1.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/2457' TO 2484’ WOB 35, ROT 25, PS 170, PP 950, AIR 1000, MAKING
VERY LITTLE WATER
08:00 - 09:30 1.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB
09:30 - 13:30 400[DRL |2 DRILL F/2484' TO 2577' WOB 40, ROT 25, PS 140, PP 850, AIR 1800, LOSING
FLUID, INCREASE AIR AND DECREASE PUMPS SLIDE 12' ROTATE 20'
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
14:00-03:30 | 1350(DRL |2 DRILL F/ 2577 TO
03:30 - 06:00 250/SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEYS
2/27/2007  |06:00 - 15:00 9.00[DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3020’ TO 3327' WOB 40K, PS 140, PP 850, AIR 1800 (MAINTAINING
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
212712007 | 06:00 - 15:00 9.00[DRL |2 VOLUME IN PITS)
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30-03:00 | 11.50/DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3327' TO 3975', WOB 40-42K, PS 140, PP 925, AIR 1800 (MAINTAINING
VOLUME IN RESERVE PIT)
03:00 - 06:00 3.00[SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
2/28/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00[DRL |2 DRILL F/ 3875' TO 4083', WOB 42-46K, ROT 40, PS 70, PP 1000, AIR 1800
09:00 - 09:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
09:30 - 14:30 5.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4083' TO 4227', WOB 46-48K, ROT 40, PS 60, PP 800, AIR 1600 (LOST
RETURNS)
14:30 - 15:30 1.00| OTH REGAIN CIRCULATION
15:30 - 16:30 1.00[DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4227' TO 4290', WOB 46-48K, ROT 40, PS 70, PP 1025, AIR 1800
16:30 - 18:00 1.50|{ OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00 - 18:30 0.50{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE
18:30 - 20:30 200/ TRP (15  |WIPER TRIP TO 2343 (FIRST 4 STANDS TIGHT, ROTATE & PUMP)
20:30 - 23:00 2.50|CIRC |1 ATTEMPT CIRCULATE F/WATER FLOW. GAINED +/- 700 BBL IN RESERVE
23:00 - 01:30 250|TRP |15  |WIPER TRIP TO BHA & STAGE IN HOLE
01:30 - 02:30 1.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM LAST 4 STANDS
02:30 - 03:30 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE
03:30 - 06:00 250|TRP |2 TOOH F/ WIRELINE LOGS (SLM)
3/1/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250{TRP |2 FINISH TOOH F/ LOGS (SLM 4286.82 - 3.18' DIFFERENCE IN TALLY, NO
CHANGE)
08:30 - 09:00 0.50{TRP [1 L/D MWD TOOL & BIT
09:00 - 11:00 2.00{LOG |1 SAFETY MEETING & R/U SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS
11:00 - 12:30 1.50{LOG |1 RIH TO 1000' W/ RUN # 1, PLATFORM EXPRESS. TOOL FAILURE - GAMMA
RAY
12:30 - 14:00 1.50{LOG |1 POOH REPAIR TOOL WHILE WAITING OTHER TOOL FROM VERNAL
14:00 - 15:30 150{LOG |1 TEST TOOL, RIH TO 2420", BRIDGED OFF, POOH (LOGGERS FOUND FLUID
LEVEL @ 1235)
15:30 - 16:30 1.00[LOG |1 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS
£16:30 - 18:30 2.00|TRP |1 L/D MUD MOTOR, MWD & MONEL. P/U BIT SUB & IBS
18:30 - 20:30 200|TRP |2 TIH TO 2422
20:30 - 22:00 1.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 2422' TO 2680"
22:00 - 23:00 100|TRP |2 TiH F/ 2680' TO 3908
23:00 - 01:30 2.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 3908’ TO 4290'
01:30 - 02:30 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE
02:30 - 06:00 3.50|TRP |2 TOOH TO RUN 9-5/8" CASING, L/D 8" DC
- NOTE: NOTIFIED DAN JARVIS W/ UTAH OGM OF INTENT TO RUN CSG &
CEMENT @ 1645 HOURS 2/28/2007
3/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| OTH LAY DOWN 8" DC & PULL WEAR BUSHING
07:30 - 09:00 150|csG |1 SAFETY MEETING & R/U WEATHERFORD CASING CREW
09:00 - 15:00 6.00|CSG |2 RUN 96 JTS 9-5/8", P110, 47# LT&C CSG, TIGHT @ 3935
15:00 - 16:00 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP & WORK 1 JT CSG THROUGH TIGHT SPOT F/ 3935' TO 3950' (NO
RETURNS)
16:00 - 16:30 050[CSG |2 RUN 3 JTS CSG, TIGHT @ 4120’
16:30 - 20:00 3.50|CIRC |1 PUMP & WORK 2 JTS CSG & LANDING JT F/ 4120' TO 4223' (LAST 44" NOT
TIGHT) LAND CASING W/ SHOE @ 4267' & FLOAT COLLAR @ 4177' (NO
RETURNS)
20:00 - 00:00 4.00| OTH INSTALL PACKOFF & PRESSURE TEST W/ 5000 PSI. INSTALL CEMENT
ISOLATION TOOL
00:00 - 01:00 1.00|CMT |1 R/U HALLIBURTON CEMENTERS & HOLD SAFETY MEETING
01:00 - 06:00 5.00[cMT |2 TEST CMT LINES W/ 5000 PSI, TEST N2 LINES W/ 8000 PSI. PUMP 10 BBL
FRESH WATER, 20 BBL OF FOAMED SUPER FLUSH & 10 BBL FOAMED
WATER. PUMP 180 BBL (688 SKS) FOAMED LEAD CMT W/ 8.5 PPG DENSITY &
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Sub s .
Date From - To | Hours | Code |~ 4e Description of Operations
3/2/2007 01:00 - 06:00 500/cMT |2 1.47/YIELD. PUMP 35 BBL (134 SKS) FOAMED LEAD CMT W/ 11 PPG DENSITY
& 1.47/YIELD. PUMP 44.9 BBL (172 SKS) TAIL CMT W/ 14.3 PPG DENSITY &
1.47/YIELD. DROP PLUG & DISPLACE W/ 308 BBL WATER. BUMP PLUG W/ 800
PSI. FLOAT HELD. NO RETURNS DURING ENTIRE JOB. PUMP 20.7 BBL (75
SKS) CAP CMT W/ 14.6 PPG DENSITY & 1.55/YIELD
3/3/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| woT |1 R/D CEMENTERS - WOC
07:30 - 08:30 1.00|woT |1 L/D LANDING JT & INSTALL WEAR BUSHING - WOC
08:30 - 11:00 250 wWoT |1 LAY OUT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS - WOC
11:00 - 12:00 1.00(EQT |1 R/U B&C QUICK TEST & PRESSURE TEST CASING W/ 1500 PSI F/ 30 MIN - OK
12:00 - 18:00 6.00| RIG 5 THAW STANDPIPE & KELLY HOSE
18:00 - 19:30 1.50|DRL |3 P/U DIRECTIONAL TOOLS & ORIENT
19:30 - 22:00 250{TRP |2 TIH W/ BIT # 4, TAG CEMENT @ 4172'
22:00 - 23:30 1.50| OTH REPLACE VALVE ON FLOWLINE & REPAIR LEAK
23:30 - 01:00 1.50{DRL |4 DRILL FLOAT EQUIPMENT, CEMENT POCKET & 10' NEW HOLE TO 4300'
01:00 - 02:30 1.50[EQT |2 CIRCULATE & FIT W/ 8.5# MUD W/ 682 PSI = EMW 11.59# (PRESSURE
DROPPED F/ 685 TO 682 15 MIN)
02:30 - 05:30 3.00[DRL |2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/ 4300’ TO 4390', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1350.
SLIDE TO BUILD ANGLE
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| OTH CONNECTION & SURVEYS
3/4/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50|DRL {2 DRILL F/ 4390' TO 4395', WOB 12, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1350
06:30 - 07:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT LINER & SWAB # 1 PUMP
07:30 - 16:00 850(DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4395' TO 4582', WOB 10, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1200 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO BUILD ANGLE - 6 SLIDES @ 5.2 HRS)
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
17:00 - 17:30 0.50|RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
17:30 - 19:00 1.50| RIG 2 STANDPIPE HAMMER UNION LEAKING, REPLACE STANDPIPE HAMMER
UNION O-RING
19:00 - 03:00 8.00[DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4582’ TO 4750', WOB 10, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1250 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO BUILD ANGLE - 5 SLIDES @ 5.4 HRS)
03:00 - 04:00 1.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
04:00 - 06:00 2.00| RIG 2 REPLACE MODULE WEAR RING & LINER # 1 PUMP
3/5/2007 06:00 - 06:30 050|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4750° TO 4770", WOB 10-12, ROT 30, PS 140, PP 1300
06:30 - 07:30 1.00| RIG 1 RIG & TOP DRIVE SERVICE
07:30 - 14:00 6.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4770' TO 4982', WOB 10-12, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 1900 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
14:00 - 15:30 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
15:30 - 16:00 0.50|CIRC |1 MIX & PUMP DRY SLUG
16:00 - 19:30 350|TRP |12 TOOH W/ BIT # 4 (MOTOR WEAK. UNABLE TO SLIDE)
19:30 - 20:30 1.00| OTH CHANGE OUT MUD MOTOR & BITS
20:30 - 22:00 150|TRP |2 TIH W/ BIT #5 TO 3900’
22:00 - 23:30 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE
23:30 - 00:30 1.00|TRP |2 TIH TO 4875'
00:30 - 01:00 0.50| REAM {1 WASH & REAM LAST STAND (PRECAUTIONARY)
01:00 - 05:00 400[DRL |2 DRILL F/ 4982' TO 5120', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 1980 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/6/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00[DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5120' TO 5257', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
14:00 - 14:30 0.50|RIG 2 PASON REPLACED FLOW METER SENSOR BOX
14:30 - 16:30 200(DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5257' TO 5361, WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO BUILD ANGLE)
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00-04:30 | 10.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 5361' TO 5695', WOB 12-14, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2000 (SLIDE AS
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~ Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code ngjdbe Description of Operations
3/6/2007 18:00-04:30 | 10.50|DRL |2 NEEDED TO BULD ANGLE)
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS

- NOTE: WHEN ORIENTATING THE TOOL THE WRONG OFFSET WAS
ENTERED. 31 WAS SCRIBED & 301 SHOULD HAVE BEEN. THIS WAS FOUND 8
HRS AFTER SART DRILLING & READJUSTED.

3/7/12007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT LINER & SWAB # 1 PUMP
07:00 - 14:30 7.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 5695’ TO 5892, WOB 12-14, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2100 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO HOLD ANGLE)
14:30 - 15:.00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:00 - 17:.00 2.00| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 5892' TO 5985', WOB 12-14, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2100 (SLIDE AS
NEEDED TO HOLD ANGLE)
17:00 - 18:00 1.00( OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00 - 04:30 10.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 5985' TO 6297', WOB 14-18, ROT 50, PS 180, PP 2150
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
- NOTE: 10-12 OZ METAL ON DITCH MAGNET
3/8/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 6297 TO 6421, WOB 8-12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2050 (ROTATE W/
REDUCED ROP & ATTEMPT TO HELP BUILD ANGLE)
13:30 - 14:30 1.00( OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
14:30 - 15:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & PUMP DRY SLUG
15:00 - 19:00 4.00| TRP 10 TOOHW/BIT#5
19:00 - 20:00 1.00( TRP 2 CHANGE BITS, REDIAL MOTOR TO 1.83, CHANGE BATTERIES & ORIENT MWD
20:00 - 22:00 2.00| TRP 10 TIH W/ BIT #6 TO SHOE
22:00 - 06:00 8.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE (TESCO POWER UNIT ENGINE LEAKING OIL INTO RADIATOR)
WAIT ON OIL COOLER FROM GRAND JUNCTION
3/9/2007 06:00 - 14:30 8.60|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AT SHOE, TESCO WAITING ON OIL COOLER FOR POWER UNIT
14:30 - 18:30 4.00| CIRC 1 CIRCULATE, INSTALL NEW OIL COOLER & FLUSH RADIATOR 4 TIMES
18:30- 01:00 6.50| TRP 2 RIG DOWN CIRCULATING HOSE & TIH F/ 3890°' TOTAL 16 STDS, WASH &
REAM F/ 4652’ TO 4736' - 4842' TO 5202' - 5890' TO 6168’ & 6360' TO 6421’
TOTAL 9 STDS
01:00 - 05:30 4.50! DRL 2 DRILL F/ 6421' TO 6514', WOB 12-14, ROT 20, PS 90, PP 2000
05:30 - 06:00 0.50{ OTH CONNECTION & SURVEYS
3/10/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 6514' TO 6544', WOB 12-14, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1800
08:00 - 08:30 0.50|RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
08:30 - 17:30 9.00| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 6544' TO 6648, WOB 14-16, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1850
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
18:00 - 02:00 8.00| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 6648' TO 6731', WOB 18-22, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1850
02:00 - 03:30 1.50|RIG 2 RETRIEVE DP SCREEN
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 6731’ TO 6739 WOB 22, ROT 30, PS 170, PP 1850

04:00 - 04:30 0.50| OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS

04:30 - 05:00 0.50| CIRC 1 MIX & PUMP DRY SLUG
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| TRP 10 TOOH W/ BIT#6
3/11/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50| TRP 2 TOOH W/BIT #6
11:30 - 13:00 1.50| TRP 2 CHANGE OUT BIT & MUD MOTOR, ORIENT MWD (MOTOR 1.5 BEND)
13:00 - 21:00 8.00| TRP 2 TIHW/ BIT #7 TO 2920' (TOOH 13 STANDS TO RETRIEVE DP SCREEN) TIHTO
4393, WASH & REAM F/ 4393' TO 4399', 4645' TO 4652', 4921' TO 4955', 5024’
TO 5044, 5099’ TO 5105', 5121' TO 5143', 5368' TO 5402, §765' TO 5794, 5894’
TO 5984
21:00 - 22:.00 1.00{ CIRC 1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN
22:00 - 23:30 1.50{ TRP 2 TiH F/ 5984’ TO 6739' (WASH & REAM)
23:30 - 01:30 2.00| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 6739’ TO 6827', WOB 16, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1900
- OTH DAYLIGHT SAVINGS TIME
02:30 - 06:00 3.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 6827 TO 6910', WOB 16, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1900
3/12/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| DRL 2 DRILL F/ 6910' TO 7014', WOB 14, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1800 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS(;’& Description of Operations
3/12/2007 | 06:00 - 12:30 6.50[DRL |2 TO HOLD ANGLE)
12:30 - 13:30 1.00{RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, CHANGE OIL IN SWIVEL
13:30 - 14:00 0.50( RIG 2 CHANGE VALVE CAP GASKETS # 1 PUMP
14:00 - 21:30 750[DRL |2 DRILL F/ 7014’ TO 7264', WOB 16, ROT 20, PS 150, PP 1850 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO HOLD ANGLE)
21:30 - 22:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE LINER GASKET # 1 PUMP
22:00 - 03:30 550|DRL |2 DRILL F/ 7264' TO 7449', WOB 16, ROT 20 PS 150, PP 1900 (SLIDE AS NEEDED
TO HOLD ANGLE
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE POPOFF VALVE # 1 PUMP
04:00 - 06:00 2.00] OTH CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/13/2007  |06:00 - 09:30 350{DRL |2 DRILL F/7449' TO 7556’ WOB 16, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2100 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB ON #1 PUMP
10:00 - 10:30 0.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/7556' TO 7575' WOB 16, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2100
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
11:00-22:00 | 11.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/7575' TO 7797 WOB 17, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2200 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE UNABLE TO SLIDE WEIGHT DROPPING ON BIT STALLING MOTOR
22:00 - 23:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND MiX DRY PIPE PILL
23:00 - 03:00 4.00|TRP (10 TRIP OUT BIT #7 TIGHT OFF BOTTOM 70000 OVERPULL
03:00 - 04:00 1.00|TRP |1 PICK UP TRICONE BIT #8 AND SET MOTOR @ 1.83
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|TRP (10 TRIP IN WITH BIT #8 PULSE TEST
3/14/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 2.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN BIT #8
08:00 - 10:30 2.50{REAM |1 WASH AND REAM 7574' TO 7797
10:30-04:00 | 17.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/7797' TO 8025' WOB 45, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2150 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE RUNNING 10 GPM TO BUILD VOLUME LOSING 15 GPM
04:00 - 06:00 2.00[SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY
3/15/2007  {06:00 - 13:00 7.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8025' T/ 8131', MW-9.3, VIS-42, WOB-45, ROT-25, PS-188, PP-2300,
SLIDE TO MAINTAIN ANGLE,
13:00 - 13:30 0.50|DRL |1 SERVICE RIG
13:30 - 17:00 350[DRL |1 DRILL F/8131' T/8204'
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP
18:00-04:00 | 10.00|DRL {1 DRILL F/8204° T/ 8413’
04:00 - 06:00 2.00SUR 1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/16/2007 | 06:00 - 11:30 550/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8413' T/ 8504', WOB-45, RPM 130, PS- 185, PP- 2300PS], MW-9.3,
VIS-42
11:30 - 12:00 0.50{ RIG 1 RIG SERVICE & TOP DRIVE
12:00 - 13:00 1.00[SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
13:00 - 19:00 6.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8504' T/ 8590"
19:00 - 22:00 3.00|TRP |10 POOH
22:00 - 06:00 8.00| ISP 1 INSPECT BHA 45 JTS HWDP, 6 COLLARS
3/17/2007 | 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| ISP 1 INSPECT BHA
07:30 - 08:30 1.00|TRP |1 P/U MUD MOTOR, CROSS OVER SUB
08:30 - 09:30 100|TRP |2 TIH, MWD NOT SENDING SIGNAL
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| TRP |13 TRIP OUT TO CHECK MWD COMMUNICATION
10:00 - 13:30 3.50|DRL |3 MWD FAILURE, TOOL IS NOT RECIEVING DOWN LOAD, TRYING ANOTHER
TOOL
13:30 - 17:30 4.00|TRP |2 TIH, TIGHT SPOT @ 4804'
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/4804' T/ 4907'
18:00 - 20:00 2.00|TRP |2 TIH BIT #9
20:00 - 21:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 8519, T/8590'
21:00 - 22:30 150[DRL |1 DRILL F/8590° T/8600', MW-9.4, VIS- 42, STKS- 168, PP- 1890PSI, WOB 12K,
ROT 30 RPM,
22:30 - 23:30 1.00[DRL |2 ATTEMPT TO SLIDE F/8600' MADE 2 FT, SURVEY
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code ngdt)ea Description of Operations
3(17/2007  |23:30 - 00:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/8602' T/8612'
00:00 - 03:30 350[DRL |2 SLIDE F/8612' T/ 8624 PUMPED SWEEP TO HELP SLIDE
03:30 - 06:00 250[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8624 T/8665
3/18/2007  {06:00 - 12:30 6.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 8665' T/ 8758, MW- 9.3, VIS-41, WOB-24K, ROP-22FT/HR, STKS-177,
PP- 1870 PSI, ROTARY-32,
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, REPLACE VALVE IN # 1 MUD PUMP
13:00 - 22:00 9.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/8758' T/8943
22:00 - 00:00 2.00|SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
00:00 - 06:00 6.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/8943 T/9073'
3/19/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 500{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 9073' T/ 9250', MW-9.4, VIS- 42, PP- 2200PS|, STKS- 189,
ROP-45FT/HR, 20K WOB, ROT-35 RPM,
11:00 - 12:00 1.00[|SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS, SURVEY EVERY 30'
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:30 - 13:30 1.00 OTH REMOVE & REPLACE 1 VALVE TO HELP SLIDE
13:30-01:00 | 11.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/9250' T/ 9530 , SLIDE TO MAINTAIN ANGLE
01:00 - 02:00 1.00| OTH REMOVE & REPLACE 1 VALVE TO HELP SLIDE
02:00 - 05:00 3.00{DRL |2 DRILL F/9530 T/ 9595 SLIDING TO MAINTAIN ANGLE
05:00 - 06:00 100|SUR |1 CONNECTIONS & SURVEYS
3/20/2007  |06:00 - 12:30 6.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/9595' TO 9781 WOB 12, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2350 SLIDE TO MAINTAIN
ANGLE SLIDING 2 HOURS WANTING DROP ANGLE TO FAST
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:00 - 16:30 350[DRL |2 DRILL F/9781' TO 9982' WOS 12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
16:30 - 17:30 1.00|SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY TIME
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| OTH CRIPPLE PUMP
18:00 - 02:00 8.00|DRL 2 DRILL F/9982' TO 10189' WOB 12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
02:00 - 03:30 1.50| RIG 2 REPLACE PUMP ROD #2 PUMP
03:30 - 04:00 0.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/10189' TO 10217' WOB 12, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
04:00 - 05:00 1.00[SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY
05:00 - 06:00 1.00[DRL {2 SLIDING F/10217' TO 10221
3/21/2007  06:00 - 06:30 0.50|CIRC {1 PUMP PILL
06:30 - 12:30 6.00| TRP |10 TRIP QUT BIT #9 HIGH DRAG OFF BOTTOM PULLING 120 OVER
12:30 - 15:00 2.50{TRP {10 TRIP IN BIT #10 TO SHOE CHANGE BHA PICK UP DRILL COLLARS
15:00 - 16:00 1.00| RIG 6 SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE
16:00 - 18:00 2.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN TO 7700' SWIVEL PACKING LEAKING
18:00 - 19:30 1.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWIVEL PACKING
19:30 - 21:30 2.00{TRP |10 TRIP IN FILL PIPE SWIVEL PACKING LEAKING
21:30 - 00:00 2.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWIVEL PACKING
00:00 - 05:00 5.00{ REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 9920' TO 10219' DUE TO HIGH TORQUE BOTTOMS
UP FLARE 30"
05:00 - 06:00 100{DRL |2 DRILL F/10219' TO 10239' WOB 20, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2400
3/22/2007  |06:00 - 15:00 9.00{DRL |2 DRILL F/1023¢' TO 10411’ WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550 SLIDE TO DROP
ANGLE
15:00 - 15:30 0.50] OTH WORK TORQUE OUT IN HOLE
15:30 - 16:00 0.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/10411' TO 10433' WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550
16:00 - 16:30 0.50{ RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 17:00 0.50|DRL |2 DRILL F/10433' TO 10452' WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550
17:00 - 18:00 1.00{SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY TIME
18:00-04:30 | 10.50{DRL |2 DRILL F/10452' TO 10746' WOB 30, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2550 SLIDE TO DROP
ANGLE AND MAINTAIN AZM
04:30 - 06:00 150[SUR |1 CONNECTIONS AND SURVEYS
3/23/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 5.00|DRL |2 DRILL F/10746' TO 10807' WOB 27, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 2650 SLIDE TO DROP
ANGLE
11:00 - 11:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To { Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
3/23/2007  |11:30 - 12:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE SWAB ROD ON #2 PUMP
12:00 - 17:00 5.00/DRL |2 DRILL F/10807' TO 10867' WOB 35, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2650 LAST SURVEY
HAD .63 INC
17:00 - 17:30 0.50{ RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB ON #1 PUMP
17:30 - 18:00 0.50/SUR |1 CONNECTION AND SURVEY
18:00 - 20:30 250{DRL |2 DRILL F/10867' TO 10878' WOB 15, ROT 25, PS 180, PP 2650 FRACTURED AND
HIGH TORQUE
20:30 - 21:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE
21:00 - 05:00 8.00| TRP |10 TRIP OUT BIT #10 BACK REAM FIRST 12 STDS
05:00 - 06:00 100{TRP |1 LAY DOWN DIRRECTIONAL TOOLS
3/24/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |1 LAY DOWN DIRRECTION TOOLS
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
07:30 - 12:30 5.00|BOP |2 TEST BOP, FLOOR VALVES, RAMS AND CHOKE TO 250 LOW AND 5000 HIGH,
BAG AND STAND PIPE TO 250 LOW AND 3500 HIGH
12:30 - 18:00 5.50 TRIP IN WITH BIT #11
18:00 - 18:30 0.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM 2 STDS TO BOTTOM, NO ROTATION DUE TO STALLING
TOP DRIVE
18:30 - 21:30 3.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/10878' TO 10889’ COULD NOT ROTATE, STALLING TOP DRIVE TRY
TO SLIDE AHEAD WEIGHT HANGING UP ON WALL
21:30 - 23:00 150]TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO LAY DOWN DC, BACK REAM FIRST 10 STDS OUT
23:00 - 23:30 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMP DRY PIPE PILL
23:30 - 06:00 6.50|TRP |2 TRIP OUT
3/25/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 500|TRP  [10 TRIP IN BIT #12 ONE DRILL COLLAR IN STRING
11:00 - 12:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM LAST 3 STDS TO BOTTOM HIGH TORQUE
12:00 - 15:00 3.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/10889' TO 10943’ WOB 45, ROT 45, PS 180, PP 2300 TORQUE
DECREASING
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30-06:00 | 14.50(DRL |1 DRILL F/10943' TO 11078' WOB 45, ROT 45, PS 190, PP 2350
3/26/2007  |06:00 - 06:30 0.50/DRL {1 DRILL F/11078' TO 11095' WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 190, PP 2350
06:30 - 07:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
07:00 - 14:00 7.00|DRL {1 DRILL F/11095' TO 11155' WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2350
14:00 - 14:30 0.50|SUR |1 DROP SURVEY
14:30 - 22:00 7.50|TRP 110 TRIP OUT BIT #12 BACK REAM FIRST FOUR STANDS
22:00 - 00:30 250|TRP |10 TRIP IN BIT #13 TO 5400'
00:30 - 02:00 1.50| RIG 2 #2 PUMP CLUTCH HABGING UP CHANGE QUICK RELEASE
02:00 - 04:30 250[TRP |10 FINISH TRIP IN
04:30 - 05:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM LAST 2 STDS TO BOTTOM
05:00 - 06:00 1.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/11165' TO 11162 WOB 45, ROT 20, PS 180, PP 2350
3/27/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11155' TO 11190', WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
11:00 - 12:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11190' TO 11195', WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
12:00 - 12:30 0.50{ RIG 2 CHANGE PUMP ROD & SWAB # 1 MUD PUMP
12:30 - 18:30 6.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11195' TO 11244', WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
£18:30 - 19:30 1.00|RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB # 1 PUMP
£19:30 - 20:00 0.50|DRL {1 DRILL F/ 11244’ TO 11246', WOB 45, ROT 30, PS 180, PP 2325
20:00 - 21:00 1.00{SUR |1 DROP SURVEY
21:00 - 22:00 1.00|TRP |10 TOOH W/ BIT # 13, ROTATE & PUMP FIRST 2 STANDS, PUMP DRY SLUG
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT PIPE SPINNERS
23:00 - 03:30 450|TRP |10 FINISH TOOH
03:30 - 06:00 250|TRP |10 TIH W/ BIT # 14
3/28/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 6 CUT DRILL LINE
07:00 - 09:30 250/ TRP |10 TIH TO 11190'
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM TO 11246', PUMP SWEEP & CLEAN BOTTOM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Sub Lo ;
Date From - To | Hours | Code Code Description of Operations
3/28/2007 | 10:30 - 16:30 6.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11246’ TO11306', WOB 22-26, ROT 30, PS 90, PP 2350 (HIGH TORQUE,
STALLING TOP DRIVE & MUD MOTOR)
16:30 - 17:30 1.00|SUR |1 CIRCULATE & DROP SURVEY
17:30 - 18:30 1.00|TRP |12 TOOH, ROTATE & PUMP OUT FIRST 2 STANDS, PULL 5 STANDS
18:30 - 19:00 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMP DRY SLUG
19:00 - 23:30 450/ TRP |12 TOOH W/ BIT # 14
23:30 - 00:30 1.00|TRP |1 CHANGE OUT STABILIZED MUD MOTOR W/ SLICK MUD MOTOR. RERUN BIT #
14
00:30 - 05:30 500/ TRP |12 TIHW/ BIT #15
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| REAM (1 WASH & REAM TO 11306', PUMP SWEEP & CLEAN BOTTOM
3/29/2007  {06:00 - 13:00 7.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11306' TO 11474', WOB 28-30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2600 (HIGH
TORQUE)
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:30-06:00 | 1650/ DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11474' TO 11756', WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 200, PP 2300 (HIGH TORQUE
SOMETIMES STALLING TOP DRIVE)
3/30/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 2.00|OTH TOTAL TIME WORKING PIPE F/ STALLED MUD MOTOR
08:00 - 09:00 1.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11756' TO 11772', WOB 26, PS 200, PP 2350 (HIGH TORQUE)
09:00 - 09:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE VALVE CAP & GASKET # 1 PUMP
09:30 - 10:30 1.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11772' TO 11777", WOB 20-24, PS 200, PP 2350 (UNABLE TO ADD
MORE WIGHT STALLING MUD MOTORY)
10:30 - 11:30 100|SUR |1 CIRCULATE & DROP SURVEY
11:30 - 20:00 850| TRP |12 TOOH W/ BIT # 15, PUMP & ROTATE 7 STANDS OFF BOTTOM
20:00 - 22:00 2.00| OTH RETRIEVE SURVEY, CHANGE OUT MUD MOTOR & BIT
22:00 - 04:30 6.50| TRP |2 TIH W/ BIT # 16 TO 11658'
04:30 - 05:00 0.50{ REAM |1 WASH & REAM TO 11777 (PRECAUTIONARY)
05:00 - 06:00 100[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11777 TO 11787', WOB 14, ROT 25, PS 200, PP 2700
3/31/2007  {06:00 - 07:30 150{DRL |1 DRILL. F/ 11787' TO 11827° WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2400
07:30 - 08:00 0.50{DRL  [1 REPAIR WASHED VALVE CAP SEAT & REPLACE GASKET
08:00 - 09:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11827' TO 11846", WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2400
09:00 - 09:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
09:30-22:00 | 1250|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 11846' TO 12039', WOB 30, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2200
22:00 - 22:30 0.50{ OTH AIR OUT PUMPS
22:30 - 01:00 250|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 12039' TO 12068', WOB 20-24, ROT 25, PS 190, PP 2200 (MUD MOTOR
STALLING W/ 22-24K ON BIT)
01:00 - 03:00 2.00|CIRC 1 CIRCULATE & PUMP SWEEP
03:00 - 04:30 1.50| OTH SAFETY MEETING. PUMP DOWN GYRODATA TOOL
04:30 - 06:00 150|TRP |2 TOOH W/ GYRODATA TOOL
4/1/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50|TRP |2 TOOH W/ GYRODATA TOOL, PUMP & ROTATE 9 STANDS OFF BOTTOM
13:30 - 16:30 3.00| OTH RETRIEVE GYRO TOOL, BREAK BIT & CHANGE OUT MUD MOTORS
(PROBLEMS DOWNLOADING DATA F/ TOOL TO COMPUTER, AFTER DOWN
LOADING GYRODATA TECH DID BATTERY CHECK LOOSING ALL DATA)
16:30 - 18:00 150|TRP |2 TIH TO CSG SHOE W/ BIT # 17
18:00 - 19:30 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE
19:30 - 20:30 100|TRP |2 TIH TO 6509' (TIGHT)
20:30 - 22:00 1.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 6509' TO 6622'
22:00 - 00:00 200{TRP |2 TiH TO 10882
00:00 - 00:30 0.50{ OTH INSTALL NEW ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
00:30 - 01:30 1.00{TRP |2 TIH TO 11933
101:30 - 02:00 0.50| REAM (1 WASH & REAM F/ 11933 TO 12022' (PRECAUTIONARY)
:02:00 - 02:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB & ROD WASHER # 2 MUD PUMP
02:30 - 03:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/ 12022' TO 12068' (PRECAUTIONARY)
03:00 - 06:00 3.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 12068' TO 12121', WOB 20, ROT 20, PS 170, PP 1850
4/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, CHANGE GRABBER DIE ON TOP DRIVE, ATTEMPT TO

Printed: 6/8/2007 2:23:21 PM




Questar E & P Page 10 of 17
Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csc;ldt:e Description of Operations
4/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50| RIG 1 CALIBRATE BIT WIGHT ON PASON. CALLED PASON
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB # 1 PUMP
08:00-18:00 | 10.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 12121’ TO 12237', WOB 28-30, ROT 35, PS 180, PP 1950 (HIGH
TORQUE)
18:00 - 23:00 5.00[DRL |t DRILL F/ 12237' TO 12277", WOB 20-25, ROT 35, PS 190, PP 2150 (HIGH
TORQUE, STALLING MUD MOTOR)
23:00 - 00:00 1.00|RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB # 2 PUMP
00:00 - 02:30 2.50/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 12277 TO 12301', WOB 20-22, ROT 30, PS 190, PP 2150 (STALLING
MUD MOTOR)
02:30 - 03:30 1.00|SUR |1 CIRCULATE & DROP SURVEY

103:30 - 06:00 250/ TRP |12 |TOOH W/BIT # 17 (ROTATE & PUMP 10 STANDS OFF BOTTOM, PULLED
: TIGHT @ 11820' TO 11750', SPOT WEIGHTED PILL)

4/3/2007 06:00 - 06:30 050|TRP |12  |TOOH, PUMP & ROTATE STAND # 10 DRILL STRING PARTED 75' BELOW
ROTARY FLOOR (PIN END WHERE TUBE FRICTION WELDED TO TOOL JOINT
BROKE)

06:30 - 13:00 6.50| WoT |4 WAIT ON FISHING TOOLS

13:00 - 15:00 2.00|FISH |5 MAKE UP OVERSHOT & BUMPER SUB TiH TO 1006' TAG FISH, ENGAGE FISH,
PULL 100000#, FISH STRIING WEIGHT 250000#

15:00 - 17:00 2.00|FISH |5 TOOH TO OVERSHOT & FISH, DISENGAGE FISH, HIGH DRAG IN CASING

17:00 - 01:00 8.00|FISH |5 TOOH LAYING DOWN 4-1/2° DROPPED DRILL PIPE (105.5 JOINTS - 3322'
RECOVERED) TOP OF FISH 4-1/2" DP TUBE W/ DIMINSION OF 5-3/4" x 2-3/4"
@ 4328 (CASING SHOE @ 4267')

01:00 - 04:00 300|FISH |5 REARRANGE DRILL PIPE ON LOCATION, LAY OUT & STRAP 3-1/2° DP (WAIT
ON LONG SKIRTED MILL)

04:00 - 06:00 2.00|FISH |5 P/ 3-1/2" DRILL PIPE

41412007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00|FISH |5 FINISH P/U 108 JTS 3-1/2" DP

09:00 - 10:00 1.00| OTH RIG DOWN FRANKS LAY DOWN TRUCK

10:00 - 11:30 150|TRP |2 TOOH STAND BACK 33 STANDS 3-1/2" DP

11:30 - 13:00 150|TRP |1 P/U & M/U MILL, BUMPER SUB, JAR, 3 EA 6-1/2" DC & ENERGIZER

13:00 - 14:00 100|TRP |2 TIH W/ FISHING ASSEMBLY TO 1346'

14.00 - 15:00 1.00| OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB TO 3-1/2" IF & RESET TORQUE

15:00 - 16:30 1.50( TRP 2 TIH TO 4288’

16:30 - 17:00 0.50| FISH 2 WASH DOWN OVER TOP OF FISH F/ 4288' TO 4292

17:00 - 06:00 13.00| FISH 1 MILL ON FiISH F/ 4292' TO 4294'

4/5/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| FISH 1 MILL ON FISH F/ 4294' TO 4295.6' (RECOVER TOTAL 3.2 LB METALCUTTINGS)

12:30 - 15:00 2.50| TRP 2 TOOH W/ SKIRTED MILL (5.5 INCHS WORE OFF MILL SKIRT & 4 INCHES
CUTRITE INSIDE WORE OFF)

15:00 - 17.00 2.00| OTH L/D FISHING TOOLS, STRAP 4" XT39 $135 - 14# DP, CHANGE OUT
ELEVATORS & SLIPS

17:00 - 18:00 1.00( OTH R/U FRANKS LAY DOWN TRUCK & HOLD SAFETY MEETING

18:00 - 22:00 4.00|OTH P/U 4" DRILL PIPE - 105 JTS

22:00 - 22:30 0.50| OTH R/D LAY DOWN TRUCK

22:30 - 00:00 1.50| OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB & RESET TORQUE

00:00 - 01:30 1.50( TRP 2 TOOH STANDING BACK 35 STANDS 4" DP

01:30 - 02:30 1.00| OTH CHANGE ELEVATORS & M/U MILL, BIT SUB, BUMPER SUB & JARS

02:30 - 06:00 3.50| TRP 2 TIH W/ 5 BLADED 8-1/2" MILL

4/6/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00( TRP 2 FINISH TiH W/ 5 BLADED MiLL, TAG @ 4286’

07:00 - 22:00 15.00| FISH 1 HIGH TORQUE F/ 4288' TO 4291'UNABLE TO MAINTAIN TORQUE, MILL DOWN
SIDE OF TUBE TO TOOL JT @ 4296.2', PICK UP TO 4280' & WORK DOWN F/
4288 TO 4291 W/ HIGH TORQUE. MILL UNTIL NO TORQUE.

22:00-02:30 4.50| TRP 2 TOOH W/ MILL # 2

02:30 - 03:00 0.50| OTH CHANGE OUT MILLS

103:00 - 06:00 3.00{ TRP 2 TIH W/ MILL # 3 - 5 BLADED 8-1/2"
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
4/7/2007 06:00-16:30 | 10.50|FISH |1 MILL F/ 4296’ TO 4298' BESIDE FISH, ATTEMPT TO MILL ON TOP OF FISH,
HIGH TORQUE THEN WALKING OFF FISH, TRYED LEAVING IN ONE PLACE @
4291.5' TO TRY AND START CUTTING GROOVE. MOST CONTACT W/ FISH
BETWEEN 4288' & 4292 THEN MILLING BESIDE.
16:30 - 19:00 250|TRP |2 TOOH W/ MILL # 3
19:00 - 20:30 1.50| OTH CHANGE OUT FISHING TOOLS
20:30 - 23:30 3.00[TRP |2 TIH W/ 8-5/8" KUTRITE WASHOVER SHOE W/ CONCAVE MILL TAG @ 4289'
23:30 - 06:00 6.50|FISH |1 P/U & WORK DOWN, TAG LIP @ 4290 MILL W/ 2K, 75 RPM, 110 SPM, 390 PSI
4/8/2007 06:00 - 14:30 850|FISH |1 MILL ON FISH @ 4290", ATTEMPT TO CUT 4-1/2" DP TUBE, MiLL ROLLED OFF
LIP, UNABLE TO FIND GROOVE IN DP. WORK MILL FROM 4284’ TO 4299', NO
TORQUE OR SET DOWN WEIGHT @ TOOL JOINT 4297'
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:00 - 17:30 250|TRP |2 TOOH W/ MILL # 4 & LAY DOWN
17:30 - 20:00 2.50| OTH CUT WALL HOOK ON BOTTOM OF # 4 MILL, M/U ON 1 JT DRILL PIPE, BEND +/-
1 DEGREE, P/U BUMPER SUB, JARS
20:00 - 22:00 200/TRP |2 TIH W/ WASH PIPE SHOE & MILL #5
22:00 - 23:00 1.00{ OTH WORK WALL HOOK SHOE OVER DP
23:00 - 04:30 550|FISH |1 MILL ON FiSH F/ 4281.9' TO 4285.1' W/ 3-7K, ROT 65-70, PS 110, PP 390
04:30 - 06:00 150|TRP |2 TOOH W/ MILL # 5
4/9/2007 06:00 - 07:30 150{TRP |2 FINISH TOOH W/ MILL #5
07:30 - 08:30 1.00{| OTH LAY DOWN MILL, TOP SUB. P/U 8-1/8* OVERSHOT DRESSED W/ 4-1/2*
GRAPPLES
08:30 - 11:00 250|TRP |2 TIH W/ OVERSHOT
11:00 - 11:30 0.50| OTH ENGAGE FISH & BREAK CIRCULATION
11:30 - 13:30 2.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & PULL STRETCH FROM DRILL STRING W/ 350K
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| OTH LAY DOWN 2 JTS DP, R/U CASED HOLE SOLUTIONS WIRELINE TRUCK
14:00 - 22:00 8.00FISH |4 RIH W/ SINKER BAR OD 1-11/16', STOPPED 4620' WIRE LINE DEPTH.
ATTEMPT TO BACKOFF @ 4546' W/ 5 ROUNDS LEFT HAND TORQUE STRING
PARTED @ 1643'. SCREW INTO STRING, RETORQUE, ATTEPMT BACKOFF W/
4 ROUNDS LEFT TORQUE, SHOOT, NO SUCCESS. ATTEMPT BACKOFF W/ §
ROUNDS LEFT TORQUE, SHOOT, NO SUCCESS. ATTEMPT BACKOFF W/ 6
ROUNDS LEFT TORQUE, STRING BACKEDOFF CONFIRMED W/ COLLAR
LOCATER @ 4546'
22:00 - 22:30 0.50|FISH |4 R/D WIRELINE TRUCK
22:30 - 02:00 350|TRP |2 TOOH W/ FISH
02:00 - 03:00 1.00| OTH L/D 10 JTS DP &TOOL JT W/ 12" TUBE
03:00 - 03:30 0.50| OTH P/U SCREW IN SUB, BUMPER SUB, JAR
03:30 - 04:30 1.00{TRP |2 TIH W/ FISHING ASSY
04:30 - 05:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR AIR LINE TO CROWN-O-MATIC & RESET
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|TRP |2 TIH, RETORQUE EVERY CONNECTION
4/10/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 200[TRP |2 TRIP IN TO 4546' CIRCULATE AND SCREW INTO FISH
08:00-06:00 | 22.00|FISH |6 REGAIN CIRCULATION, FIRE FISHING JARS, NOT GAINING WHILE DOING
THIS, PULL 428,000 AND ROTATE LET TORQUE ZERO AND TRY AGAIN WORK
PIPE F/4556' TO 4530' ADD WALLNUT AND MICA
4/11/2007 | 06:00 - 09:30 350|FISH |6 WORK STUCK PIPE PULL 428000 TORQUE INTO PIPE NOT GAINNING LOSING
PUMP PRESSURE
09:30 - 11:00 1.50|CIRC |1 PULL 400000 INTO PIPE AND REDUCE PUMP RATE WAIT FOR LOGGING
TRUCK
11:00 - 12:30 1.50|FISH |4 HELD SAFETY MEETING WITH LOGGERS, RIG UP LOGGERS, PULL 2" BLOW
' PLUG ON GOOSE NECK FOR WIRE LINE ENTRY
$12:30 - 20:00 7.50/FISH |4 FIRST RUN 20" SINKER BAR 1 11/16' OD WITH 10’ JAR TO 8808, SECOND RUN
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSc:Jdbe Description of Operations
4/11/2007  |12:30 - 20:00 7.50(FISH |4 FREE POINT 1 5/8" OD TO 8808, FIND FREE POINT ON DRILL STRING, FREE
POINT 4813' WIRE LINE DEPTH
20:00 - 00:30 450|FISH |4 RUN IN BACK OFF TOOL PUT 4 TURNS OF LEFT HAND TORQUE IN PIPE AND

WORK IN FIRST SHOT DID NOT BACK OFF, RELOAD TOOL AND PUT 5 TURNS
OF LEFT HAND TORQUE IN PIPE AND WORK IN BACK OFF SUCCESSFULL
4813' 280" OF FISH ANTICIPATED

00:30 - 01:00 0.50 FISH 4 RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK
01:00 - 05:00 4.00| TRP 2 TRIP OUT WITH FISH PULLED 320000 TO COME FREE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{ TRP 4 LAY DOWN FISH, SCREEW IN SUB WASHED OUT AND FIRST TOOL JT FIRST
JT BENT BADLY
4/12/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50| TRP 2 TRIP IN WITH SCREW IN SUB TO FISH
08:30 - 09:30 1.00{ REAM |1 WASH AND REAM 8 JTS TO FISH
09:30 - 15:30 6.00{ FISH 6 SCREW INTO FISH BREAK CIRCULATION 10 PS 2000 PSI LET WELL CLEAN

AND START WORKING STUCK PIPE, NOT GAINING FIRING JARS, PULL
428000 AND PUT TORQUE IN PIPE PUMP SWEEP TO MAKE SURE WE ARE

i CIRCULATING THROUGH BIT SAW SWEEP AT 11500 STROKES

15:30 - 18:30 3.00|FISH 4 RIG UP AND RUN FREE POINT FIRST JOINT BELOW FISH TOP 4813' WAS NOT

FREE, RIG DOWN WIRE LINE TRUCK
18:30 - 01:.00 6.50{ FISH 6 WORK STUCK PIPE, JARRING TO 330000, PUL INTO STRING 428000 AND PUT

TORQUE IN SET DOWN ON STRING TO 80000 NO GAIN

RIG UP WIRE LINE AND FREE POINT, HIT OBSTRUCTION IN DP AT 5265
LOGGER DEPTH FREE POINT 5255'

RUN BACK OFF TOOL TO FREE POINT 5255 AND BACK OFF

TRIP OUT FISH #4 NOT TIGHT COMING OFF BOTTOM

09:00 - 10:30 1.50( TRP LAY DOWN 14 RECOVERED JTS OF DP SCREW IN SUB WASH OUT
10:30 - 12:30 2.00| WOT WAIT ON SCREW IN SUB WITH OUT CIRCULATION PORT

12:30 - 13.00 0.50| OTH BOP FUNCTION TEST

13:00-17:00 4.00| TRP TRIP IN TO FISH TOP §255' WASH LAST 8 STDS TO TOP

S

01:00 - 03:00 2.00| FISH

03:00 - 06:00 3.00| FISH
4/13/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00| TRP

&N A

N

17:00-21:30 4.50|FISH 6 SCREW INTO FISH AT 5255 WORK STUCK PIPE UNABLE TO BREAK
CIRCULATION, JAR AND PULL 428000 AND ROTATE

21:30 - 01:30 4.00| FISH 4 RUN 30' 1 11/16" SINKER BAR TO 8810', RIG UP FREE POINT AND RUN IN
PIPE STUCK AT 4851' FREE POINT 4817

01:30 - 05:00 3.50| FISH 4 RIG UP PERFORATING GUNS 12 .25" HOLES TOP 8758 BOTTOM 8761’
LOGGER DEPTH

05:00 - 06:00 1.00| FISH 6 SCREW IN BLOW PLUG ON BONNET AND BREAK CIRCULATION WORK
STUCK PIPE HARD TO BREAK CIRCULATION 25 STROKES 2000 PS|

4/14/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| FISH 6 WORK STUCK PIPE,, JAR, PULL 428000 AND PUT TORQUE IN NOT GAINING

LOT OF SAND COMING OVER SHAKERS WHILE CIRCULATING

12:30- 16:00 3.50| FISH 4 RIG UP AND RUN FREE POINT FOUND FREE POINT AT 7495' LOGGER DEPTH

RIG UP AND RUN BACKOFF TOOL, WORK TORQUE IN PIPE AND BACK OFF
AT 7495' LOGGER DEPTH

16:00 - 18:00 2.00|FISH

(3]

[18:00 - 19:30 1.50| CIRC |1 CIRCULATE TO CLEAN HOLE SAND COMING OVER SHAKERS

19:30 - 22:.00 2.50| TRP 2 TRIP OUT THE FISHING STRING TO 4 1/2" DP

22:00 - 03:30 5.50{ TRP 4 LAY DOWN 30 JTS OF 4 1/2" DP THEN LAY DOWN FISH #6, 72 JTS BENT
03:30 - 05:30 2.00{ TRP 2 TRIP IN 3 1/2" HT38 OUT OF DERRICK

05:30 - 06:00 0.50| TRP 3 LAY DOWN 3 1/2" DP

4/15/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00| TRP 3 LAY DOWN 3 1/2" HT-38 DRILL PIPE

08:00 - 08:30 0.50| TRP 1 MAKE UP FISHING TOOLS

08:30 - 09:00 0.50| OTH RIG DOWN LAY DOWN MACHINE

09:00 - 11:30 2.50| TRP 2 TRIP IN 4" DRILL PIPE STRAP IN

11:30 - 12:30 1.00( OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SuB

12:30 - 13:00 0.50| OTH RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE

13:00 - 22:00 9.00| TRP 2 PICK UP 128 JTS OF 5" DRILL PIPE CIRCULATE THEM DOWN 4650' TO 4900'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Sub " .
Date From - To | Hours | Code | ~0 40 Description of Operations
4/15/2007  {13:00 - 22:00 9.00|TRP |2 CIRCULATE ABOVE FISH
22:00 - 23:30 150{CIRC |1 SCREW INTO FISH, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION WOULD NOT CIRCULATE
WORK PIPE AND FEATHER PUMP
23:30 - 05:00 550[FISH |6 WORK STUCK PIPE, FIRE JARS AT 340000, PULL 490000 AN D TORQUE INTO
PIPE, BUILD MUD VOLUME, FULL CIRCULATION
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{FISH |4 PULL BLOW PLUG ON GOOSE NECK AND RIG UP WIRE LINE TRUCK
4/16/2007 | 06:00 - 13:00 7.00[FISH |4 FREE POINT, UNABLE TO PASS BY 8810’ RIG UP BACK OFF TOOL CHANGE
ROPE SOCKET FOR SHORTER TOOL SO IT WOULD PASS 8810' GOT TO 8835'
WITH TOOL, WORK IN TORQUE TO BACK OFF AND IT BACK OFF MANUALLY
ABOVE DC SCREW BACK IN AND WORK TORQUE IN
13:00 - 14:00 1.00|FISH |6 WORK STUCK PIPE CIRCULATE WORK TORQUE BACK INTO STRING
14:00 - 16:30 250[FISH |4 RUN BACK OFF TOOL TO 8832' AND BACK OFF
16:30 - 17:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT
17:00 - 22:00 5.00[TRP |2 TRIP QUT WITH FISH #7
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| OTH RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK
23:00 - 01:00 2.00[TRP |4 LAY DOWN FISH #7 42 JTS LAST 5 JTS BADLY BENT
01:00 - 02:30 1.50| TRP |1 PICK UP FISHING TOOLS
02:30 - 03:00 0.50| TRP |2 PICK UP 15 JTS OF 4" DRILL PIPE
03:00 - 03:30 0.50| OTH RIG DOWN LAY DOWN MACHINE
03:30 - 05:30 2.00|TRP |2 TRIP IN TO HOLE TO SHOE
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| RIG 6 SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE
4/17/2007 | 06:00 - 09:30 350[TRP |2 TRIP INTO TOP OF FISH AT 8832'
09:30 - 11:00 150|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT
11:00 - 13:00 2.00(FISH |6 TRY TO BREAK CIRCULATION COULD NOT, JAR AT 420000 AFTER JARS
FIRED PULL INTO PIPE 490000
13:00 - 18:30 550|FISH |4 RIG UP WIRE LINE, GO IN WITH SINKER BARS TO 10736", PICK UP FREE
POINT TOOL FREE POINT AT 10717
18:30 - 22:00 350(FISH |4 RUN BACK OFF TOOL TO 10717' WORK TORQUE INTO PIPE, PIPE BACKED
OFF ABOVE DC SCREW BACK IN AND WORK TORQUE INTO PIPE
22:00 - 01:00 3.00[FISH |4 RUN BACK OFF TOOL AGAIN TO 10717' WORK TORQUE INTO STRING
BACKED OFF AT 10717' LOGGER DEPTH
01:00 - 03:30 2.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT GAS AT 5221 UNITS
03:30 - 06:00 2.50|TRP |2 TRIP OUT FISH #8
4/18/2007  |06:00 - 08:30 2.50|TRP |2 TRIP OUT WITH FISH #8 TO DC
08:30 - 10:00 1.50| OTH RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK
10:00 - 13:30 350/ TRP |4 LAY DOWN DC AND 60 JTS OF FISH PIPE BENT
13:30 - 14:30 1.00|TRP |1 PICK UP BHA CHANGE OUT SCREW IN SUB, CHANGE LAY DOWN TRAUPH
TO OTHER SIDE OF CAT WALK
14:30 - 18:30 4.00|TRP |2 PICK UP 20 JTS OF 4 1/2" HWDP AND 48 JTS OF 4" DP
18:30 - 19:00 0.50| OTH RIG DOWN LAY DOWN MACHINE
19:00 - 23:30 450|TRP |2 TRIP IN OUT OF DERRICK
23:30 - 01:00 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT
01:00 - 03:00 2.00|FISH |6 SCREW INTO FISH AT 10717 WORK STUCK PIPE NO CIRCULATION, JAR AT
420000, AND PULL INTO STRING TO 490000 TORQUE INTO PIPE
03:00 - 06:00 3.00[FISH |4 RIG UP AND RUN SINKER BAR
4/19/2007  !06:00-06:00 | 24.00|FISH |4 CLEAR OBSTRUCTION FROM ID OF HWDP STARTED AT 10967' GO IN WITH 1
; 3/8" CORE TUBE WITH SINKER BARS AND HAMMER UNTIL WE DID NOT GAIN
i ANY MORE THAN PICK UP 3/4” SUCKER BAR 4' LONG AND HAMMER
; STARTED AT 10967 NOW WE ARE AT 11034' CORE BARREL RECOVERS
ABOUT ONE FOOT EACH RUN
4/20/2007  |06:00 - 11:30 550(FISH |4 RUN IN FREE POINT TOOL, FREE POINT 10898', RIG UP AND RUN BACK OFF
TOOL, BACK FISH OFF AT 10898'
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| OTH RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK AND PUT 2" BLOW PLUG IN GOOSE NECK

Printed: 6/8/2007 2:23:21 PM




QuestarE & P Page 14 of 17

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Sub L .
Date From - To | Hours | Code |~ 4 Description of Operations
4/20/2007  {12:00 - 14:00 2.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND CLEAN WELLBORE
$14:00 - 21:00 7.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT FISH #9
21:00 - 22:00 1.00| OTH RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK
22:00 - 23:00 1.00|TRP |3 LAY DOWN 20 JTS OF 4 1/2" HWDP
23:00 - 00:00 1.00|TRP |4 LAY DOWN FISH #9 1 JT OF 4.5 DP AND 5 JTS OF HWDP BENT
00:00 - 01:00 1.00| OTH PUT 14 JTS OF 4 15/16" DC ON RACKS AND 4" HWDP STRAP
01:00 - 06:00 5.00[TRP |1 PICK UP BHA, 8 1/2" TRI-CONE, BIT SUB, X0, 14 DC, 20 HWDP, JARS, 15
HWDP
4/21/2007 | 06:00 - 06:30 0.50|TRP |2 PICK UP 4" DP
06:30 - 07:00 0.50{ OTH RIG DOWN LAY DOWN TRUCK
07:00 - 09:30 250|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 4600
09:30 - 10:00 0.50{ OTH CHANGE SAVER SUB TO XT-39
10:00-22:00 | 12.00{REAM |1 REAM BRIDGE AT 4600' AND THROUGH BUILD SECTION TO 5700° AT 8600'
CIRCULATE AND WORK HOLE UNTIL IT CLEANED UP, FINISH TRIP IN
WASHED LAST 11 STDS TO BOTTOM FISH TOP BY STRAP 10876’
22:00 - 03:00 5.00/CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND WORK PIPE LARGE AMOUNTS OF SAND CIRCULATE UNTIL
IT CLEANED UP MIX FRESH GELL
03:00 - 06:00 3.00{TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO PICK UP CEMENT STINGER 50000 TO 60000 OVER PULL
4/22/2007 | 06:00 - 10:30 450|TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO PICK UP CEMENT STINGER
10:30 - 11:00 0.50|TRP |1 LAY DOWN BIT AND BIT SUB, PICK UP CEMENT STINGER FOUR 1/2" PERFS
FIVE FOOT OF PERFS TOOL 24' DOWN TO TOP OF PERFS
11:00 - 17:00 6.00| TRP |2 TRIP INTO HOLE TO PLUG BACK
17:00 - 19:30 2.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE, BOTTOM OF TOOL AT 10873’
19:30 - 20:30 1.00{CMT |2 CEMENT WITH HALLIBURTON, PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 3500 PSI, PUMP 20
BBLS OF WATER PREFLUSH, 320 SACKS OF 17.5 PPG 53.5 BBLS OF CLASS G
CEMENT, 2.3 BBLS WATER, DISPLACED WITH 118 BBLS OF WATER FULL
RETURNS DURRING JOB PLUG DOWN 20:16
20:30 - 21:30 100|TRP |2 PULL 10 STDS
21:30 - 23:30 2.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE WELL BORE CLEAN
23:30 - 04:00 450|TRP |2 TRIP OUT LAY DOWN STINGER
04:00 - 04:30 0.50{ OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
04:30 - 06:00 1.50{80P |2 RIG UP BOP TEST TRUCK AND TEST
4/23/2007  06:00 - 12:30 6.50{BOP |2 TEST BOP, BLINDS, PIPES, CHOKE LINE, CHOKE, FLOOR VALVES AND KELLY
VALVE 250 LOW AND 5000 HIGH, BAG AND STAND PIPE 250 LOW AND 3500
HIGH ALL TESTED GOOD
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
13:00 - 15:30 250|TRP |1 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND ORIENT MOTOR IS .25 RPG SET AT 1.50
15:30 - 16:00 0.50|RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:00 - 21:30 550|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 10122'
21:30 - 22:30 1.00| REAM {1 WASH AND REAM TO CEMENT TOP AT 10325'
22:30 - 23:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL CEMENT F/10325' TO 10351' KICK OFF POINT
23:00 - 06:00 7.00|DRL |2 SLIDE FROM 10351 TO 10368' TIME DRILL THEN ADD WEIGHT TO KICK OFF
4/24/2007  |06:00-21:00 | 15.00|DRL |7 SLIDE TO SIDE TRACK 10368' TO 10436' ATTEMPT TO TIME DRILL WEIGHT
WOULD STACK IN DRILL STRING AND RELEASE CAUSING LOSS OF TOOL
FACE, ATTEMPT HEAVY WEIGHT TO PUSH BEND, DISABLE PUMP, AT 10426'
WORK IN TROUGH AND THEN TRY TO SIDE TRACK WITH LIGHTEST WEIGHT
POSSIBLE SAMPLES SHOWED 50% SHALE AND 50% CEMENT THIS WENT
BACK TO 90% CEMENT
21:00 - 21:30 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMP WEIGHTED PILL
21:30 - 02:30 5.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT TO SET MOTOR UP TO 1.85
02:30 - 03:00 0.50| OTH ADJUST MOTOR FROM 1.5 TO 1.85
03:00 - 04:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP INTO SHOE
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE

Printed: 6/8/2007 2:23:21 PM




QuestarE & P Page 15 of 17
Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cst;’dbe Description of Operations
4/25/2007 | 06:00 - 09:00 3.00{TRP |2 FINISH TRIP IN
109:00 - 11:00 2.00{DRL |7 ATTEMPT TO SIDE TRACK, 10436' TO 10451’ PUT 16000 WOB WOULD SEE
i SLIGHT DIF TIME DRILL UNTIL WOB HIT 30000 AND ROCK DRILL STRING
SMAPLES 95% CEMENT
11:00 - 11:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
11:30 - 21:00 9.50 SIDETRACK 10451' TO 10466° 16000 WOB TIME DRILL ADD 1 INCH EVERY 2

MINUTES WHEN WAIT STACKED TO 30000 WORK HOLE INSTEAD OF
ROCKING SAMPLES 40% SHALE AND 60% CEMENT 10466’

21:.00-21:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB IN #2 PUMP
21:30 - 06:00 8.50| DRL 7 SIDETRACK 10466’ TO 10475’ 16000 WOB TIME DRILL ADD 1 INCH EVERY 2
MINUTES WHEN WAIT STACKED TO 30000 WORK HOLE SAMPLES ALL
CEMENT
4/26/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50| DRL 7 SIDETRACK 10475’ TO 10478', 16K WOB, TIME DRILL W/ 1 INCH EVERY 2 MIN.
WHEN WEIGHT STACKED TO 30K WORK HOLE. SAMPLES: 15% FORMATION
11:30 - 12:30 1.00| CIRC 1 CIRCULATE, MIX & PUMP DRY SLUG
12:30 - 19:00 6.50| TRP 10 TOOH W/ BIT # 20
19:00 - 19:30 0.50| OTH CHANGE BITS
19:30 - 00:00 4.50| TRP 10 TiH W/ BIT # 21 & BREAK CIRCULATION
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| DRL 7 BUILD TROUGH F/ 10450' TO 10473, WOB 8-12K
4/27/12007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
06:30 - 08:00 1.50( DRL 7 SIDETRACK,CONTINUE BUILD TROUGH TO 10473'
08.00 - 16:30 8.50| DRL 7 SIDETRACK F/ 10472- 10480 ADD 50K WT. FELL OFF TO 28K WITH NO
DIFFERENTIAL 40% -60% SHALE ON RETURNS
16:30 - 18:00 1.50{CIRC |5 CIRC SAMPLES F/ SIDETRACK

18:00 - 19:30 1.50( DRL 7 SIDE TRACK F/ 10480° TO 10487', TIME DRILL 5 MIN PER INCH ADD WT. 20K
UNABLE TO SUSTAIN WT. ON BIT FELL OFF TO NO DIFFERENTIAL 90%
CEMENT 10% SHALE ON RETURNS

19:30 - 20:30 1.00| CIRC CIRCULATE & SURVEY

20:30 - 23:30 3.00{ DRL 7 SIDE TRACK F/ 10487’ TO 10490' 1MIN PER INCH 8-10K WT ON BIT WITH
25 PSI OF DIFFERENTIAL 80% CEMENT 20% SHALE ON RETURNS

-

23:30 - 06:00 6.50| DRL 7 SIDE TRACK BUILDING TROUGH F/ 10458' TO 10478'
4/28/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00( DRL 7 FINISH BUILDING TROUGH F/ 10458- 10478
07.00 - 06:00 23.00( DRL 7 SIDETRACK TIME DRILL SMIN PER INCH F/10477-10490 INCREASE SPEED
4MIN PER INCH 10480-10495 INCRESE 3MIN PER INCH 10495-10500
INCRESE 2MIN PER INCH 10500-10505 1MIN PER INCH 10505 TO 10507
- NOTE @ 10491 SAMPLES FELL FROM 85% SHALE 15% CEMENT TO 60%
SHALE / 40% CEMENT
4/29/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50| DRL 7 TIME DRILL 1MIN PER INCH F/10507-10521 RETURNS GOOD
08:30 - 09:00 0.50|RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
09:00 - 14:00 5.00| DRL 7 TIME DRILL 1MIN PER INCH F/10521-10546 SHALE 80% CEMENT 20%
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 2 SERVICE TOP DRIVE CHANGE O-RING
14:30 - 16:00 1.50( DRL 1 START ROTATING F/10546-10566 10-15K WOB
16:00 - 16:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB 1 # PUMP
16:30 - 20:00 3.50| DRL 1 ROTATING 10566-10610
20:00 - 20:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB 1 #PUMP
20:30 - 06:00 9.50| DRL 1 DRLG S/F 10610-10632 R/F 10632-10642 S/F10642-10650 R/F 10650-10673
S/F 10673-10681 R/F10681-
4/30/2007 06:00 - 15:30 9.50| DRL 1 DRLG F/10705-10833
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:00 - 17:30 1.50( DRL 1 DRLG F/10833-10855 MUD MOTOR PRESSURE SPIKED
17:30 - 18:30 1.00| CIRC 1 CIRC BOTTOM UP /FOR TRIPS
18:30 - 20:00 1.50| TRP 10 BACK REAM 4 STS WI/TOP DRIVE / MIX / PUMP PILL
20:00 - 02:00 6.00| TRP 10 TOOH WITH BIT 21#

Printed: 6/8/2007 2:23:21 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Sub e .
Date From - To | Hours | Code |54 Description of Operations
4/30/2007  |02:00 - 03:30 1.50|TRP |1 L/D MUD MOTOR /BIT P/U MUD MOTOR /BIT 22# ORIENT MWD /DIRECTIONAL
TOOLS
03:30 - 06:00 250 RIG 2 REPAIR BROKE DRIVE DRAW WORKS /CHAIN
5/1/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00| RIG 2 REPAIR DRAW WORKS CHAIN
08:00 - 09:30 150[TRP |10 TIH TO SHOE
09:30 - 11:00 1.50| RIG 6 CUT 780" BAD DRILLING LINE / CHECK BRAKES
11:00 - 14:30 350|TRP |10 TIH T/ 10737
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| REAM |1 SAFETY WASH & REAM F/10737-10855 NO FILL
15:00-03:00 | 1200{DRL |1 DRLG 10855 - 11072 ROTATING / SURVEY/SLIDES
03:00 - 03:30 0.50| RIG 1 REPAIR LEAK ON STAND PIPE
03:30 - 06:00 250|/DRL |1 DRLG 11072-11105 WOB 20K, ROT 30, PS 150, PP 2380
5/2/2007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50|/DRL |1 DRLG 11105-11144 WT 20-22K, ROT 30, PS 150, PP 2300 PRESSURING UP
MOTOR FAILED
09:30 - 10:30 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP BUILD DRY PIPE PILL
10:30 - 13:00 250{TRP |12 TRIP OUT / BACK REAM 3 STS/ PUMP PILL/ POOH PULL 80-90K OVER
STRING WT
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR 5" ELEVATORS
14:00 - 17:30 350[TRP |12 POOH L/D DIRECTIONAL TOOLS BIT 22#
17:30 - 19:00 1.50| RIG 2 REPAIR TOP DRIVE / DOUBLE BALL VALVE / SAVER SUB CHANGE OUT
19:00 - 02:30 750/ TRP |10 TIH / FILL PIPE / COLLAR/SHOE/ 10300
02:30 - 03:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH / REAM F/ 10995-11144 SAFETY REAM NO FILL
03:00 - 06:00 3.00|/DRL |1 DRLG F/11144-11194 WOB 6-8K, ROT 30, PS 150, PP 2300
5/3/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00|DRL |1 DRLG F/11194-11277 7 TO10KWT RT 30 SPM 150 PP2100
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE ROUTINE
13:30 - 14:30 1.00|DRL |1 DRLG F/11277-11383 PRESSURED UP MOTOR FAILURE
14:30 - 15:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CONDITION - CIRC BOTTOMS UP
15:00 - 15:30 050[SUR |1 DROP MULTI SHOT TOOL F/ SURVETY
15:30 - 22:30 7.00|TRP |12 BACK REAM 3 STS (50-70K PULL)- PUMP PILL - TOOH W/ BIT # 24 (90-100K
PULL)
22:30 - 00:00 1.50| TRP |1 L/D /PU MUD MOTOR/ BIT 23#/24#
00:00 - 05:30 550/ TRP |2 TIH FILL PIPE SHOE /10300
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| REAM |1 SAFETY WASH /REAM F/ 11283-11383 NO FILL
5/4/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRLG F/ 11383 - 11404
07:00 - 07:30 0.50{ RIG 2 CHANGED SWAB HEAD ON PUMP 1#
07:30 - 14:00 6.50{DRL |1 DRLG F/ 11404- 11479 WT 20K 180 SPM PP 2800
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE ROUTINE
14:30 - 15:00 050/DRL |1 DRLG F/ 11479- 11486
15:00 - 16:00 1.00| RIG 2 REINSTALL BELTS ON 1# PUMP /ADJUST
16:00-05:30 | 1350(/DRL |1 DRLG F/ 11486 - 11721 WT 20 K SPM180 PP 2900 RT 40
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB # 2 PUMP
5/5/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00|DRL |1 DRLG F/ 11721- 11766 WT 20K ROT 30 PP2900 SPM 180
10:00 - 11:00 1.00|DRL |1 RIG SERVICE ROUTINE / TOP DRIVE
11:00 - 15:00 400[DRL |1 DRLG F 11766- 11791 SLOW P-RATE
{15:00 - 15:30 0.50|SUR |1 DROP SURVEY TOOL
15:30 - 22:30 7.00|TRP |10 BACK REAM 4 STS PULL 70-80K OVER STRING MIX- PUMP PILL TOOH
22:30 - 00:00 1.50| TRP |1 L/D P/U MUD MOTOR /BIT 24# 25#
00:00 - 01:30 1.50|TRP |10 TIH FILL PIPE @ 4250 SHOE
01:30 - 03:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP /CUT 101" DRLG LINE/ CHECK BRAKES
03:00 - 04:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE DOUBLE BALL VALVE ON TOP DRIVE
04:00 - 06:00 200|TRP |2 TIH FILL PIPE @9050'
5/6/2007 06:00 - 07:30 150|TRP |2 TIH
07:30 - 08:30 1.00|REAM |1 SAFETY WASH / REAM F 11671- 11791 NOFILL
08:30 - 12:00 350|DRL |1 DRLG F/11791- 11861 5-17K WT RT 20 PP2950 180 SPM

Printed: 6/8/2007 2:23:21 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:dbe Description of Operations
5/6/2007 12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 1 ROUTINE RIG SERVICE
12:30-01:30 | 13.00{DRL |1 DRLG F/ 11861- 12073
01:30 - 02:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE NAIL IN POPOFF PUMP 1#
02:00 - 06:00 4.00|DRL |1 DRLG F/12073-12116 20-22K WT RT20 SPM180 PP2900
5/7/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50|DRL |1 DRLG 12116-12119 WT 25K RT30 SPM180 PP3000
06:30 - 07:00 050[SUR |1 DROP SURVEY / MIX PILL
07:00 - 12:30 5.50|TRP |10 TOOH W/BIT 25# DRY PULL FIRST 4 STS 90-100K OVER STRING WT.
12:30 - 14:00 1.50| OTH RETRIEVE SURVEY TOOL /LD/PU MOD MOTOR BITS 25#/26#
14:00 - 19:00 500/ TRP |10 TIH W/BIT 264 (SLM) 1.6 DIFFERENT FROM PIPE TALLEY NO CHANGE
19:00 - 20:00 1.00| REAM (1 SAFETY WASH/ REAM F/ 11957-12119 CLEAN BOTTOM - NO FILL
20:00-06:00 | 10.00{DRL |1 DRLG F/12119- 12243 WT 20K RT 30 SPM180 PP 2800 (BOP DRILL)
5/8/2007 06:00 - 08:00 200/{DRL |1 DRLG F/ 12243- 12276 WT 20K SPM 180 PP 2800 RT 30
08:00 - 09:00 1.00| RIG 1 CHANGE SEAT / VALVE PUMP 1#
09:00 - 13:00 4.00[DRL |1 DRLG F 12276 - 12339
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 RIG 1 ROUTINE RIG SERVICE
13:30 - 21:00 750|DRL |1 DRLG F/12339-12485 WT 22 SPM 180 PP 2850 RT 30
21:00 - 22:30 1.50{CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP / PUMP SWEEP
22:30 - 00:30 2.00|TRP |14 SHORT TRIP 10 STS DRY PULL 90-100 K OVER STRING WT.
00:30 - 03:00 250/ CIRC |1 CIRC COND BOTTOMS UP X2
03:00 - 04:00 1.00{SUR |1 PUMP GYRO DATA - SURVEY TOOL R/U FRANKS L/D TRUCK
04:00 - 06:00 2.00{TRP |3 TOOH LDDP@ 11750 W/ FRANKS SAFETY MEETING HELD
5/9/2007 06:00-16:30 | 10.50| TRP |3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE
16:30 - 17:30 1.00|RIG 2 WORK ON BREAK OUT TONGS
17:30 - 20:30 3.00/TRP |1 LAY DOWN BHA
20:30 - 22:00 1.50{ OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
22:00 - 00:00 200|csG |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING WITH CASING CREW, RIG UP CASING CREW
00:00 - 06:00 6.00|CSG |2 RU N 5 1/2" CASING 50% RUN
5/10/2007  |06:00 - 12:00 6.00/CSG |2 RUN FLOAT SHOE AND FLOAT COLLAR BACK TO BACK AND 267 JTS OF 5
1/2" P-110, #17 CASING SET AT 12468' KB
12:00 - 15:30 3.50[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE CASING, RIG DOWN CASING CREW, YP 6
15:30 - 18:30 300[cMT |2 CEMENT WITH HALLIBURTON, PRESSURE TEST CEMENT LINES TO 6000 PS!
AND N2 LINES TO 9000 PS| PUMP 10 BBLS OF WATER AND 20 BBLS OF
SUPER FLUSH AND 10 BBLS OF WATER, LEAD CEMENT MIX DENSITY 14.3
PPG FOAM DENSITY 11 PPG 330 BBLS 1290 SKS, TAIL CEMENT 14.3 PPG
23,56 BBLS 90 SKS 1.47 YIELD DISPLACED WITH 289 BBLS OF WATER PLUG
BUMPED AND FLOATS HELD PLUG DOWN 18:30 6/9/07 GOOD RETURNS
DURRING JOB
18:30 - 03:30 9.00|wot |1 WOC, CLEAN MUD TANKS
103:30 - 06:00 2.50|CcsG |7 BLEED PRESSURE THROUGH CHOKE OFF BACK SIDE OF CASING 100 PSI,
RIG UP WINCHES TO PICK UP BOP AND SET SLIPS WILL SET SLIPS WITH
78000
5/11/2007  |06:00 - 08:30 250|CsG |7 LIFT BOP AND SET SLIPS, SLIPS SET 100000
08:30 - 12:30 4.00|BOP |1 NIPPLE DOWN AND SNUB OUT BOP
12:30 - 14:00 1.50{ OTH INSTALL NIGHT CAP TIG RELEASE 14:00 5/10/2007
14:00-06:00 | 16.00{LOC |4 RIG DOWN TOP DRIVE, MUD TANKS, FLOOR AND MUD PUMPS RIG DOWN
75%

Printed: 6/8/2007 2:23:21 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 3 { 36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

i 3~0YP-38 992

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code Csélge Description of Operations

8/17/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( BOP 1 TIGHT HOLE!
Initial completion of well. Schlumberger WL ran Dipole Sonic and CBL logs on this
well on 7/12 & 7/13/07.
On 8/13/07 - MIRU Basin Well Service to start completion of well. ND WH & NU
10K# BOP and flowback manifold. SIFN.
On 8/14/07 - tally and rabbit in the hole with a 4-3/4" bit, 5-1/2" csg scraper and new
2-3/8" EUE 8rd 4.7# P-110 thg to 10400". Checked drag every 500" and had 7000#
over pull at 10400' and rotating with power swivel with 1000# torque. Circ hole
clean with 2% KCL water & SIFN.
On 8/15/07 - Continue to tally and rabbit in the hole as above. Tag at 12400" and
circ down to 12414'. Check for drag and had 12M to 15M# drag off bottom. Circ
hole clean with 2% KCL water. POOH with tbg & bit & scraper. SIFN.
On 8/16/07 - MIRU Quick Test and test csg. BOP's and flowback manifold to 9000#
and held OK. MIRU Cutters WL and perforate the following intervals at 3 JPF using
a 3-3/8" csg gun and "Power Pak" charges. Wingate: 12292' - 12300° & 12316" -
12324' (48 holes) per the Dipole Sonic log dated 7/12/07. Hole was full of 2% KCL
water prior to perforating and on a slight vacuum after perforation. RDMO Cutters
WL & SIFN.
24 Hour Forecast: On 8/17/07 will RIH with tbg and start to swab well down.
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324’
12292' - 12300'

8/20/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00] TRP 2 TIGHT HOLEM
On 8/17/07 SICP = vacuum. RIH with tbg as follows: All tbg is 2-3/8" EUE 8rd
P-110 4.7#; collar; 1 jt; 1.81" "F" Nipple at 378 jts to surface. Tbg tail @ 12258’ &
“F" Nipple @ 12224'. Tbg above all perfs. RU swab. IFL @ surface. Make 12
swab runs & recovered 88 bbis of water with no gas and no fluid entry. FFL @
4000". SD for weekend due to lightning. SIFW.
24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab well.
LLTR = 178 bbls. (left over csg volume).
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316’ - 12324’
12292' - 12300'

8/21/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLEm iy

On 8/20/07: SICP=125# SITP=vac:. RIH w/swab IFL @ 4000". Made 25 swab runs
and recovered 113 bbls of water showing light gas with no fluid entry. FF! @ 9200

Printed: 9/4/2007 1:45:26 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

8/21/2007

8/22/2007

8/23/2007

8/24/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

SICP of 125# SIFN
On 8/21/07 will continue to swab well. Est. load left to rec. 65 bbls

Load from yesterday: 178
Minus daily recovery: 113
LLTR: 65

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316’ - 12324’

12292' - 12300°

TIGHT HOLEunmn

On 8/21/07, SICP = 275#, SITP = 300#. Blow tbg to 0 psi - Ful/Open. Rec 0 bbls.
RIH w/ swab. IFL @ 8550'. Made 19 swab runs. Rec 66 bbls of water showing
light gas with no fluid entry for final 3 hours. FFL @ 11,600". Csg = 350#. Have rec
1 bbl overload.

24 Hour Forecast: Will check fluid level & break down perfs with 1000 gals of 15%
& 72 Bio-balls.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324
12292 - 12300'

On 8/22/07 - SICP = 500#, SITP = 400#. Blow tbg down to 0 psi full/open. RIH w/
swab tag FL @ 11,500". POOH w/ swab. Blow csg down to 0 psi ful/open. Loaded
tole w/ 280 bbls 2% KCL. RU Halliburton and broke down perfs @ 12292' - 12324'
with 1000 gals of 15% HCL acid & 72 Bio-balls. Got break @ 3551#. Had max
pressure of 4500#, avg pressure of 4000#. Max rate of 4.6 BPM, avg rate = 4.5
BPM, ISIP = 1600#. Total load of 97 bbls. RD Halliburton. Open well up w/ 800#.
Blow to 0 psi fulllopen. Rec 20 bbis. RIH w/ swab. IFL @ surface. Made 23 swab
runs. Rec 135 bbls (155 bbls total). Showing lite gas with 14 bbls fluid entry for last
hour. FFL @ 3800'. Csg=0psi. pH=7. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab well.
LLTR: 222 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324°
12292’ - 12300

Printed: 9/4/2007 1:45:26 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26

Spud Date: ~ 2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007

Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Sub L .
Date From - To | Hours | Code Code Description of Operations

8/24/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( SWAB 1 On 8/23/07, SICP = 225#, SITP = 350#. Blow tbg down to 0 psi fullopen. Rec 0
bbls. RIH w/ swab. IFL @ 3350". Made 16 swab runs. Rec 73 bbls water.
Showing med gas. FFL @ 1200". pH =7. Start flowing w/ 25# tbg pressure.
Full/open & 350# csg pressure. Rec 38 bbls water. Open csg up @ 2:00 PM. Blow
to 0 psi fulfopen wouldn't flow. Tbg pressure down to O#. SIFN.
24 Hour Forecast: Will try to flow up csg & continue to swab weil.
LLTR: 111 bbls
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324’
12292' - 12300

8/27/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLEMmmmuy
On 8/24/07 SITP = 1350# & SICP = 1250#. Open tbg on a 22/64" choke and bled
off to 0# in 45 minutes. Attempt to flow csg to establish flow rate and bled off csg to
50# in 1 hr on a 22/64” choke with no fluid recovery. Sl csg. Open tbg on a full 2*
line to the flow back tank and recovered 20 bbis of slight gas cut water in 1 hr and
an additional 10 bbls in 1/2 hour and tbg dead. Open up the 9P csg and equalize
over to 7P csg to 1800#. Open tbg with SICP = 1750# and recovered 15 bbis of
water and tbg died. RU swab. IFL @ 3850". Make 14 swab runs and recovered an
additional 45 bbls of slight to med gas cut water with FFL at 2300’ and final SICP =
1700 but tbg would not sustain a flow. RD swab & SIFW. Recovered a total of 90
bbls of water today with an est LLTR =21 bbls.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab well in.

LLTR: 21 bbls
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324’
12292' - 12300

8/29/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( SWAB (1 TIGHT HOLE!Hmmmy

On 8/27/07 SITP = 1300# & SICP = 2400# with 1900# of SICP still left on the csg
from 9P well. Open tbg on a 36/64" choke and bled off csg to 0#. RU swab. IFL @
3850#. Make 3 swab runs and recovered 21 bbls of gas cut water with FFL @
1800" and final SICP = 2100#. Tbg started to flow. Flowed the tbg for 7-1/2 hours
with a final FTP = 30# on a 28/64" choke with final SICP = 625# with no fluid
recovery the last 1/2 hour with a total recovery between swabbing and flowing of 59
bbis. Appears tbg is loading up. SIFN. Have recovered 38 bbls over load.

On 8/28/07 SITP = 1350# and SICP = 1700#. Open tbg on a 28/64" choke and bled
dead in 1/2 hour. RU swab. IFL @ 200". Make 1 run and recovered 6 bbls of water
and thg started to flow with SICP = 1700#. Open tbg full open for 15 minutes to
unload tbg and placed thg on a 18/64" choke with a final FTP = 450# and a final

Printed: 9/4/2007 1:45:26 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26

Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

8/29/2007 06:00 - 16:00

10.00

SWAB

SICP = 825# after recovering a total of 14 bbls of water and final flow of dry gas.
MIRU PLS WL and ran tandem BHP bombs and flowed the tbg for 3 hours on a
18/64" chooke with no additional fluid recovery and final FTP = 10# and final SICP =
775#. Land bombs with soft-set in "F” Nipple at 12224' with well Sl at 2:00 PM on
8/28/07. Well will remain S| untii bombs are pulled on Tuesday, 9/4/07. Have
recovered a total of 52 bbls over load.

LLTR: 52 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316’ - 12324’
12292’ - 12300

Printed: 9/4/2007 1:45:26 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
8/17/2007  |06:00 -16:00 | 10.00,BOP |1 TIGHT HOLE!!

Initial completion of well. Schiumberger WL ran Dipole Sonic and CBL logs on this
well on 7/12 & 7/13/07.

On 8/13/07 - MIRU Basin Well Service to start completion of well. ND WH & NU
10K# BOP and flowback manifold. SIFN.

On 8/14/07 - tally and rabbit in the hole with a 4-3/4" bit, 5-1/2" csg scraper and new
2-3/8" EUE 8rd 4.7# P-110 tbg to 10400'. Checked drag every 500" and had 7000#
over pull at 10400 and rotating with power swivel with 1000# torque. Circ hole
clean with 2% KCL water & SIFN.

On 8/15/07 - Continue to tally and rabbit in the hole as above. Tag at 12400 and
circ down to 12414'. Check for drag and had 12M to 15M# drag off bottom. Circ
hole clean with 2% KCL water. POOH with tbg & bit & scraper. SIFN.

On 8/16/07 - MIRU Quick Test and test csg. BOP's and flowback manifold to 3000#
and held OK. MIRU Cutters WL and perforate the following intervals at 3 JPF using
a 3-3/8" csg gun and "Power Pak" charges. Wingate: 12292' - 12300' & 12316" -
12324' (48 holes) per the Dipole Sonic log dated 7/12/07. Hole was full of 2% KCL
water prior to perforating and on a slight vacuum after perforation. RDMO Cutters
WL & SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: On 8/17/07 will RIH with tbg and start to swab well down.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324’

12292' - 12300

8/20/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00|{ TRP 2 TIGHT HOLE!!

On 8/17/07 SICP = vacuum. RIH with tbg as follows: All tbg is 2-3/8" EUE 8rd
P-110 4.7#; collar; 1 jt; 1.81" "F" Nipple at 378 jts to surface. Tbg tail @ 12258' &
*F" Nipple @ 12224'. Tbg above all perfs. RU swab. IFL @ surface. Make 12
swab runs & recovered 88 bbls of water with no gas and no fluid entry. FFL @
4000'. SD for weekend due to lightning. SIFW.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab well.
LLTR = 178 bbls. (left over csg volume).

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292' - 12300

8/21/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE! it

On 8/20/07: SICP=125# SITP=vac: RIH w/swab IFL @ 4000". Made 25 swab runs
and recovered 113 bbls of water showing light gas with no fuid entry. FFI @ 9200

Printed: 10/4/2007 12:58:27 PM

RECEIVED
0CT 05 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MININT



QuestarE & P Page 2 of 9

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

8/21/2007

8/22/2007

8/23/2007

8/24/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

SICP of 125# SIFN
On 8/21/07 will continue to swab well. Est. load left to rec. 65 bbls

Load from yesterday: 178
Minus daily recovery: 113
LLTR: 65

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292' - 12300

TIGHT HOLERmni

On 8/21/07, SICP = 275#, SITP = 300#. Blow tbg to 0 psi - Fuil/Open. Rec 0 bbis.
RIH w/ swab. IFL @ 8550'. Made 19 swab runs. Rec 66 bbls of water showing
light gas with no fluid entry for final 3 hours. FFL @ 11,600'. Csg = 350#. Have rec
1 bbl overload.

24 Hour Forecast: Will check fluid level & break down perfs with 1000 gals of 15%
& 72 Bio-balls.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292' - 12300'

TIGHT HOLE!Hnit

On 8/22/07 - SICP = 500#, SITP = 400#. Blow tbg down to O psi full/open. RIH w/
swab tag FL @ 11,500 POOH w/ swab. Blow csg down to 0 psi full/open. Loaded
hole w/ 280 bbls 2% KCL. RU Halliburton and broke down perfs @ 12292' - 12324’
with 1000 gals of 15% HCL acid & 72 Bio-balls. Got break @ 3551#. Had max
pressure of 4500#, avg pressure of 4000#. Max rate of 4.6 BPM, avg rate = 4.5
BPM, ISIP = 1600#. Total load of 97 bbls. RD Halliburton. Open well up w/ 800#.
Blow to 0 psi full/open. Rec 20 bbls. RIH w/ swab. IFL @ surface. Made 23 swab
runs. Rec 135 bbls (155 bbis total). Showing lite gas with 14 bbis fluid entry for last
hour. FFL @ 3800'. Csg=0psi. pH=7. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab well.
LLTR: 222 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316 - 12324’
12292' - 12300
TIGHT HOLE!!!M
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

8/24/2007

8/27/2007

8/29/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

On 8/23/07, SICP = 225#, SITP = 350#. Blow tbg down to 0 psi full/lopen. Rec 0
bbls. RIH w/swab. IFL @ 3350'. Made 16 swab runs. Rec 73 bbls water.
Showing med gas. FFL @ 1200". pH = 7. Start flowing w/ 25# tbg pressure.
Full/open & 350# csg pressure. Rec 38 bbis water. Open csg up @ 2:00 PM. Blow
to 0 psi full/open wouldn't flow. Tbg pressure down to O#. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will try to flow up csg & continue to swab well.
LLTR: 111 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324’
12292' - 12300

On 8/24/07 SITP = 1350# & SICP = 1250#. Open tbg on a 22/64" choke and bled
off to O# in 45 minutes. Attempt to flow csg to establish flow rate and bled off csg to
504 in 1 hr on a 22/64" choke with no fluid recovery. Sl csg. Open tbg on a full 2"
line to the flow back tank and recovered 20 bbls of slight gas cut water in 1 hr and
an additional 10 bbls in 1/2 hour and tbg dead. Open up the 9P csg and equalize
over to 7P csg to 1800#. Open tbg with SICP = 1750# and recovered 15 bbls of
water and tbg died. RU swab. IFL @ 3850'. Make 14 swab runs and recovered an
additional 45 bbis of slight to med gas cut water with FFL at 2300’ and final SICP =
1700’ but tbg would not sustain a flow. RD swab & SIFW. Recovered a total of 90
bbls of water today with an est LLTR = 21 bbls.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab well in.
LLTR: 21 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292' - 12300

TIGHT HOLEN i

On 8/27/07 SITP = 1300# & SICP = 2400# with 1900# of SICP still left on the csg
from 9P well. Open tbg on a 36/64" choke and bled off csg to O0#. RU swab. IFL @
3850#. Make 3 swab runs and recovered 21 bbis of gas cut water with FFL @
1800’ and finat SICP = 2100#. Tbg started to flow. Flowed the tbg for 7-1/2 hours
with a final FTP = 30# on a 28/64" choke with final SICP = 625# with no fluid
recovery the last 1/2 hour with a total recovery between swabbing and flowing of 59
bbls. Appears tbg is loading up. SIFN. Have recovered 38 bbls over load.

On 8/28/07 SITP = 1350# and SICP = 1700#. Open tbg on a 28/64" choke and bied
dead in 1/2 hour. RU swab. IFL @ 200'. Make 1 run and recovered 6 bbls of water
and tbg started to flow with SICP = 1700#. Open thg fuil open for 15 minutes to
unload tbg and placed tbg on a 18/64" choke with a final FTP = 450# and a final
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

8/29/2007

9/5/2007

9/11/2007

9/12/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

LoC

SWAB

SICP = 825# after recovering a total of 14 bbis of water and final flow of dry gas.
MIRU PLS WL and ran tandem BHP bombs and flowed the tbg for 3 hours on a
18/64" chooke with no additional fluid recovery and final FTP = 10# and final SICP =
775#. Land bombs with soft-set in "F* Nipple at 12224' with well Sl at 2:00 PM on
8/28/07. Well will remain S until bombs are pulled on Tuesday, 9/4/07. Have
recovered a total of 52 bbls over load.

LLTR: 52 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324
12292' - 12300

ON AM of 9/4/07 SITP = 1800# and SICP = 2250#. MI PLS and pull BHP bombs
and with bombs out of hole at 2:00 PM on 9/4/07. RDMO Basin Well Service. Well
will remain S} until further notice. RDUFA.

LLTR: 52 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324°

12292' - 12300

TIGHT HOLE! iy

Resumption of completion. On 9/10/07 MIRU Basin Well Service to continue
completion of well. SITP = 1900# and SICP = 2400#. Left well SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will flow/swab test.
LLTR: 52 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316 - 12324'
12292' - 12300

On 9/11/07 SITP = 1900# and SICP = 2400#. BlLed off tbg on a 36/64" choke and
had no fluid recovery. RU swab. IFL @ 700". Make 1 run and recovered 4 bbis of
water and tbg started to flow. Flow tbg for 3 hours on a 48/64" choke with a final
SICP = 450# and recovered 46 bbls of water with a final FTP = 25#. No fluid
recovery the last hour. RURU swab. IFL @ 8200'. Make 4 swab runs with FFL @
11400 while pulling from the "F” nipple with a hourly entry rate of 3 BPH of gas cut
water and final SICP = 350#. Recovered a total of 61 bbls of water today. RD
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

9/12/2007

9/13/2007

9/14/2007

9/25/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

OTH

PERF

swab. SIFN.
24 Hour Forecast: Will swab/flow test.
LLTR: 113 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324
12292' - 12300

On 9/12/07, SITP = 1300# & SICP = 1500#. Bled off tbg in 2-1/2 hours and
recovred 4 bbls of water with final SICP = 450#. RU swab. IFL @ 11400". Make 8
swab runs and recovered an additional 8 bbls of slight gas cut water with FFL @
12000’ white pulling from the "F" Nipple at 12220' and making 2 runs per hour with a
recovery of 1 BPH. Recovered a total of 12 bbls of water today with final SICP =
250#. RD swab. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Wil swab/flow test.
LLTR: 125 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300

TIGHT HOLEN

On 9/13/07 SICP and SITP=1200#. Bled off tbg.to 50# and recovered 3 bbl.of
water. Bled off csg.and tbg.to 0#. POOH with all tbg..Install lower blind rams and Si
the well. This report is suspended pending frac scheduling of this zone.

Load from yesterday: 125 over
Minus daily recovery: 3
LLTR: 128 over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324’

12292' - 12300

TIGHT HOLEM

Resumption of report discontinued on 9/14/07. On AM of 9/24/07 SICP = 1900#.
MIRU Halliburton frac crew, Stinger WH Services & Praxair CO2 gas. Frac gross
perforated Wingate intervals 12292' - 12324' down csg using a 70% quality 40#
Purgell 2% KCL x-linked gel water system as follows: Pump a 2050 gal pre-pad
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code gol:ibe Description of Operations

9/25/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| PERF |2 followed by a 1500 gal pad and stage 1-4 ppg PRC 20/40 mesh sand in 4000 gals
of fluid and stage 4 ppg 20/40 mesh PRC sand in 2500 gals of fluid and flush with
8470 gais of fluid. The 1st half of flush was a 60% quality foam followed by a water
cushion. Total of 43000# of 20/40 mesh PRC sand and a total fluid load of 440
bbls. Max rate = 32.5 BPM; avg rate = 27.8 BPM; max psi = 4869#; avg psi =
3660#; ISIP = 3613# (.73). RD Stinger WH service and open the csg on a 18/64"
choke 1 hour later after the frac with a SICP = 1500#. Finish RDMO remaining
services. Continue to flow the well on various chokes overnight and at 6:00 AM on
9/25/07 FCP = 50# on a 64/64" choke with a light trace of CO2 and no fluid.
Recovered an est 235 bbls of water.
24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to flow test or RIH with tbg to clean out and swab.
LLTR: 205 bbls
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324
12292' - 12300

9/26/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLEN!
At 7:00 AM on 9/25/07 FCP = 0# on a full 2" line from Wingate perfs 12292 -
12324'. Sl csg for 1 hour and built to 100#. Attempt to unload well on a full 2" line
to the pit and csg died in 5 minutes. Pump 20 bbls of 2% KCL water down the ¢sg
for top kill. RIH w/ 2-3/8" tbg as folllows: NC, 1.81" "F" Nipple & tbg. Tag @
12363'. Pull NC to 12248’ with "F" Nipple @ 12215'. RU swab. IFL @ 4100". Make
9 swab runs and recovered 48 bbls of CO2 gas cut water. Tbg started to flow with
FFL at 2000' and final SICP = 350#. Tbg died in 1/2 hour with no fiuid recovery.
SIFN. ON AM of 9/26/07 SITP = 0# & SICP = 900#.
24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab.
LLTR: 177 bbls
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324'
12292" - 12300'

9/27/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE! It

On AM of 9/26/07 SITP = 0# and SICP = 900#. RU swab. IFL @ 4000". Make 18
swab runs and recovered 77 bbls with FFL @ 5000'. Tbg started to flow water and
CO2 gas at 1:00 PM on a full 2" line with 25#. Continue to flow the tbg overnight
and at 5:00 AM on 9/27/07 tbg was dead with a SICP = 900#. Recovered a total of
260 bbls of water in the last 24 hours. At 7:00 AM on 9/27/07 FTP = dead and SICP
= 950#. RU swab. IFL @ 7100".

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab.& flow test.
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26

Location:
Rig Name:

UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

9/27/2007

9/28/2007

10/1/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

LLTR: 177 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324'
12292' - 12300

Testing Wingate perfs 12292' - 12324'.

On AM of 9/27/07 FTP = 0# and SICP = 900#. RU swab. IFL @ 7100". Make 2
runs and tbg started to flow after recovering 12 bbls of water. Tbg flowed for 2
hours and died with final SICP = = 650# and recovered an additional 16 bbls in the
2 hour flow period. RU swab. IFL @ 8700". Make 2 runs and recovered 10 bbis of
water and tbg flowed for 2 hours end died after flowing back 5 bbls of water with
final SICP = 575# and recovering lite mist of CO2 with a trace of methane vapor.
RU swab. Make 1 run with IFL @ 10,000° and flowing mist of same with finai SICP
= 525# after a 2-1/2 hour flow period and recovered an additional 13 bbls of water.
Turned well over to flow tester. Well flowed 1 bbl in the 1st hour with no recovery in
the next 11 hours. Sl the tbg for a 4 hour period and SITP went to 300# and bled off
immediately. At 7:00 AM on 9/28/07 FTP = 0# and SICP = 725#.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab.& flow test.
LLTR: 140 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324°
12292' - 12300

Testing Wingate perfs 12292' - 12324'.

On AM of 9/28/07 FTP = O# & SICP = 725#. RU swab. IFL @ 4100". Make 4 runs
and recovered 22 bbls of water & tbg started to flow with a final SICP = 650# and
FFL @ 3400'. Flowed for 2 hours and recovered an additional 9 bbls of water and
tbg died. RU swab. IFL @ 7500'. Make 3 swab runs and tbg start to flow again
and recovered 12 bbls swabbing and 3 bbls flowing for 1 hour. RU swab. IFL @
10,000". Make 1 run and rec 3 bbls of water and tbg flowed again for 1/2 hour and
RU swab. Make 1 additional run with IFL @ 10,000' while pulling from the "F"
Nipple @ 12215' tbg would not flow. SIFW. When tbg was flowing max psi was
25# on a full open 2" line. Final SICP = 500#. Recovered a total of 53 bbis of CO2
gas cut water with a very slight show of methane vapor.

24 Hour Forecast: Will POOH w/ tbg & prepare for additional zones.
LLTR: 193 bbis over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:dbe Description of Operations
10/4/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00{ SWAB |1
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324
12292 - 12300
10/3/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| PERF |2 TIGHT HOLEMnmm
Testing Wingate perfs 12292 - 12324".
On 10/1/07 SITP = 1400# & SICP = 2000#. Bled down well to 0#. Pump 50 bbls of
2% KCL water to keep well dead. POOH w/ tbg. SIFN. On 10/2/07 will set a CIBP
over the above perfs and perforate Entrada zones.
On 10/2/07 SICP = 250#. MIRU Cutters WL and wireline set a 5-1/2" CIBP @
12260" to shut off Wingate perfs 12292' - 12324'. Perforate the following Entrada
intervais using a 3-3/8" csg gun and *Power Pak" charges at 3 JPF & 120" phasing
per the Dipole Sonic log dated 7/12/07: 11911' - 11913'; 11926’ - 11928'; 11948’ -
11952'; 11977 - 11979'; 11987 - 11989'; 11992' - 11994' & 12068' - 12070' (48
holes). IFL & FFL @ 6500°. ISICP = 250#, FSICP = 3004. RDMO Cutters WL.
Tagged CIBP prior to perforating. Bled off csg. RIH w/ 2-3/8" collar; 1 jt of tbg;
1.81" "F" Nipple and 364 jts of tbg to surface. Land tbg in hanger at 11889’ and "F"
Nipple @ 11835'. SIFN.
24 Hour Forecast: Will start testing gross perforated Entradainterval 11911" -
12070'".
LLTR: 193 bbls over
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324
12292' - 12300
Final Water = 193 bbis over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068’ - 12070
11992 - 11994'
11987' - 11989"
11977 - 11979
11948' - 11952'
11926' - 11928
11941°- 11913
10/4/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE!

Testing Wingate perfs 11913' - 12070",

On AM of 10/3/07 SITP = 450# and SICP = 400#. Bled off tbg with no fluid
recovery. RU swab. IFL @ 4800'. Make 19 swab runs and recovered 106 bbls of
water with no trace of methane but with light gas --probably leftover CO2. FFL @
9600 with a final SICP = 325# with no apparent fluid entry. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab the above Entrada perfs.

LLTR: 51 bbis

Printed: 10/4/2007 12:58:27 PM




Questar E & P

Operations Summary Report

Page 9 of 9

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994°

11987 - 11989

11977' - 11979

11948' - 11952

11926' - 11928

11911'- 11913

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code éol& Description of Operations
10/4/2007  |06:00-16:00 |  10.00| SWAB |1
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[(71/8/2007) Rachel Medina - FR 7P-36-14-19 COMP.pdf

'Pagg1 1

8/17/2007

8/20/2007 06:00 - 16:00

8/21/2007 06:00 - 16:00

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:  36- 148 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

10.00

10.00

TRP 2

SWAB

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

‘ Deseription dfbpefatiohé' 'v

TIGHT HOLEN!
Initial of well. Sct ger Wi.ran Dipofe Sonic and CBL logs onthis
wellon 7/12 & 7113/07.

On8/13/07 - MRU Blasin Well Service to start completion of well. ND WH & NU
10K# BOP and flowback manifold. SIFN.

On8/14/07 - tally and rabbit inthe hole witha4-3/4" kit, 5-1/2" csg scraper and new
2-3/8" EUE 8rd 4.7# P-110 thg to 10400, Checked drag every 500’ and had 7000#
over pull at 10400 and rotating with power swivel with 1000# torque. Circhole
clean with 2% KCL water & SIFN.

On 8/15/07 - Continue fotally and rabbit inthe hole as above. Tag at 12400 and
circ down to 12414, Check for drag and had 12M to 15M# drag off bottom.  Circ
hele clean with 2% KCL water. POOH with tbg & bit & scraper. SIFN,

On 8/16/07 - MIRU Quick Test and test csg. BOP's and flowback manifold to 9000
and held OK. MIRU Cutters WL and perforate the following intervals at 3 JPF using
a3-3/8" csg gun ard "Power Pak” charges. Wingate: -12202' - 12300 & 12316 -
12324' (48 holes) per the Dipole Sonic log dated 7/12/07. Hole was full of 2% KCL
water prior to perforating and on a slight vacuum after perforation. RDMO Cuiters
WL & SIFN,

24 Hour Forecast: On 817/07 willRIH with tbg and start to swab well down,

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
CsgDepth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316" - 12324'

12282 - 12300

TIGHT HOLEM

Ong/17/07 SICP = vacuum. RIH withtbg as follows: All fog is 2-3/8" EUE &d
P-110 4.74# collar; 1jt; 1.81" "F"Nipple at 378 jis tosurface. Thg taill @ 12258 &
"F" Nipple @ 12224. Thg above all perfs. RU swab, IFL @ surface. Make 12
swab runs & recovered 88 bbls of water with nogas and no fluid entry. FFL@
4000. SD for weekend due to lightning. SIFW.

24 Hour Farecast: Will continue to swab well.
LLTR = 178 bbls. (left over csg volume).

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth; 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

TIGHT HOLEWIHI nit

On 8/20/07: SICP=125# SITP=vac: RIH w/swab IFL @ 4000, Made 25swab runs
and recovered 113 bbls of water showing light gas with no fluid entry. FFI @ 9200'
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Rig Name: UNIT

| Fom-To

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 36-14-S 19E 26

8/21/2007 06:00 - 16:00

8/22/2007 06:00 - 16:00

8/23/2007 06:00 - 16:00

8/24/2007 06:00 - 16:00

10,00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SwaB

SWAB

SWAB

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
{ Rig Number: 236

SICP of 125# SIFN
On 8/21/07 willcontinue to swab well. Est. load left fo rec. 65 bbils

Load from yesterday: 178
Minus daily recovery: 113
LLTR: 65

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12202 - 12300

TIGHT HOLEMI it

On&21/07, SICP = 275# SITP = 300#, Blow thg to 0 psi - Full/Open. Rec 0 bbls,
RIiHw/swab. IFL @ 8550. Made 19swab runs. Rec 66 bbis of water showing
light gas with no fluid entry for final 3hours. FFL@ 11,600 Csg = 350# Have rec
1 bbi overload.

24 Howr Forecast: Will check fluid level & break down perfs with 1000 gals of 15%
&72 Bio-balls.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depih; 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12202' - 12300

TIGHT HOLENMM i

On &/22/07 - SICP = 500#, SITP = 400# Blow tbg down to O psi fulliopen. RIH w/
swab tag FL @ 11,500. POOH w/swab. Blow ¢sg down to O psi full/open. Loaded
hole w/ 280 bbls 2% KCL. RU Halliburten and broke down perfs @ 12202' - 12324'
with 1000 gals of 15% HCL acld & 72 Bio-balls. Got break @ 3551%. MHad max
pressure of 4500#, avg pressure of 4000# Max rate of 4.6 BPM, avg rate = 4.5
BPM, ISIP = 1600# Total load of 97 bbls. RD Halliburton. Opén wellupw/ 800#
Blow fo 0 psi full/open. Rec 20 bbls. RIH w/swab, IFL @ surface. Made 23 swab
runs. Rec 135 bbls (155 bbis total), Showing lite gas with 14 bbls fluid entry for last
hour, FFL @ 3800, Csg =0psi. pH=7. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab well.
LLTR: 222 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316 - 12324

12202' - 12300

TIGHT HOLEmMtIM 1y

Printed: 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Location: 36- 14-S 19E 26

Rig Name: UNIT

- Dats

8/24/2007 06:00 - 16:00

81272007 06:00 - 16:00

8/28/2007 06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

On 8/23/07, SICP = 225%, SITP = 350#. Blow tbg down to O psi fulllopen. Rec 0
bbls. RIH w/swab. IFL. @ 3350 Made 16swab runs. Rec 73 bhls water.
Showing med gas. FFL.@ 1200. pH =7. Start flowing w/ 25% ibg pressure.
Full/open & 350# csg pressure. Rec 38 bbis water. Open csg up @ 2:00 PM. Blow
to O psi fullfopen wouidnt flow. Thg pressure down to 0%. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast Wilitry toflow upcsg & continue fo swab well.
LLTR: 111 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316" - 12324'

12292' - 12300

TIGHT HOLEmI! it

On 8/24/07 SITP = 1350# & SICP = 1250#. Open thg ona 22/64" choke and bled
off to 0% in45 minutes. Attempt to flow csg to establish flow rate and bled off csgto
50# in1 hron a22/64" choke with no fluid recovery. Si csg. Open thy ona full 2°
line to the flow back tank and recovered 20 bbis of slight gas cutwater in1 hr and
an additional 10bbls in1/2 hour and thg dead. Open upthe 9P csg and equalize
over to 7P csgto 18004 Open tbg with SICP = 1750# and recoverad 15 bbls of
water and thy died. RU swab. IFL @ 3850. Make 14 swab runs and recovered an
additional 45 bbls of slight tomed gas cut water with FFL at 2300 and finat SICP =
1700" but tbg would not sustain aflow. RD swab & SIFW. Recovered atotal of 90
bbls of water today with an est LLTR = 21 bbls.

24 Howr Forecast: Will continue to swab well in,
LLTR: 21 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth:  12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292 - 12300

TIGHT HOLEM! it}

On 8/27/07 SITP = 1300# & SICP = 2400# with 1900# of SICP sfill left onthe csg
from 9P well. Open tbg ona 36/64" choke and bled off csgto 0% RU swab. IFL @
3850#. Make 3 swab runs and recovered 21bbls of gas cut water with FFL @
1800' and final SICP = 2100# Tbyg started to flow. Flowed the thg for 7-1/2 hours
withafinal FTP = 30# ona 28/64" choke with final SICP = 625# with no fiuid
recovery the last 1/2 hour with afotal recovery between swabbing and flowing of 59
bbls. Appears thg is loading up. SIFN. Have recovered 38 bbls over load.

On 8/28/07 SITP = 1350# and SICP = 1700% Open tbg ona 28/84" choke and bied
dead in 1/2 hour, RU swab. IFL @ 200" Make 1run and recovered 6 bbls of water
and thy started to flow with SICP = 1700# Open tbg full open for 15 minutes to
unload thg and placed tbg ena 18/64" choke with afinal FTP = 450% and afinal

Printedt  11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



36-14S 19E 26

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:

Rig Name: UNIT

8/29/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10,00
9/5/2007 06:00 - 16:00
9/11/2007 06:00 - 16:00
9/12/2007 06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

Swas

SWAB

LOC

SWAB

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

SICP = 825# after recovering atotal of 14 bbls of water and final flow of dry gas.
MIRU PLS WLand rantandem BHP bombs and flowed the tbg for 3hours ona
18/64" chooke with no additional fluid recovery and final FTP = 10# and final SICP =
775# Land bombs with soft-set in "F" Nipple at 12224' with well Sl at 200 PMon
8/28/07. Well willrenain Stuntil bombs are pulled on Tuesday, 94/07. Have
recovered atotal of 52 bbls over load,

LLTR: 52 bbis over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292 - 12300

TIGHT HOLENH 1

ON AM of 9/4/07 -SITP = 1800# and SICP = 2260% Ml PLS and pull BHP bombs
and with bombs out of hole at2:00 PMon 9/4/07. RDMO Basin Well Service, Well
willremain Sl until further notice. RDUFA.

LLTR: 52 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs;

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12282' - 12300

TIGHT HOLENMmM

Resumption of completion. On 9/10/07 MIRU Basin Well Service to confinue
completion of well. SITP = 1900# and SICP = 2400%. Left well SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will flow/swab test.
LLTR: 52 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324’

12282 - 12300

TIGHT HOLEmMMN

On@/11/07 SITP = 19004 and SICP = 2400#. Bled off tbg ona 36/64" choke and
had no fluid recovery. RU swab. IFL@ 700, Make 1 run and recovered 4 bbls of
water and thg started to flow. Flow tbg for 3 hours on a 48/64" choke with a final
SICP = 450# and recovered 46bbls of water with afinal FTP = 25% No fluid
recovery the last hour. RURU swab. IFL @ 8200 Meake 4 swab runs with FFL. @
11400" while pulling from the "F" nipple with a hourly entry rate of 3 BPH of gas cut
water and final SICP = 350# Recovered atotal of 61 bbls of water today. RD

Printed: 11/6/2007 3:23:18 PM



Ezige 5]

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

36- 148 19E 26

Location:

Rig Name: UNIT
9/12/2007 06:00 - 16:00
91312007 06:00 - 16:00
914/2007 08:00 - 16:00
9/25/2007 06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

QTH

PERF

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

swab, SIFN.
24 Hour Forecast: Will swab/fiow test.
LLTR: 113 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12282 - 12300

TIGHT HOLERIIMY 11

OngM2/07, SITP = 1300# & SICP = 1500#. Bled off thg in2-1/2 hours and
recovred 4bbls of water with final SICP = 450# RU swab, IFL @ 11400 Make 8
swab runs and recovered an additional 8bbls of slight gas cut water with FFL@
12000" while pulling from the "F" Nipple at 12220' and making 2 runs per hour with a
recovery of 1 BPH. Recovered atotal of 12 bbis of water today with final SICP =
250¢. RD swab. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will swabfflow test.
LLTR: 125 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

TIGHT HOLEmHIMM 1t

On 9/13/07 SICP and SITP=1200%. Bled off tbg.to 50# and recovered 3 bbl.of
water, Bled off csg.and thg.to 0% POOH with all tbg..Install lower blind rams and Si
the well. This report is suspended pending frac scheduling ofthis zone.

Load from yesterday: 126 over
Minus daily recovery: 3
LLTR: 128 over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

TIGHT HOLENmm 1t

Resumption of report discontinued on 9/14/07. On AMof 9/24/07 SICP = 18004,
MIRU Halliburton frac crew, Stinger WH Services & Praxalr CO2gas. Frac gross
perforaied Wingate intervals 12202' - 12324' down csg using a70% quality 408
Purgell 2% KCL x-linked gel water system as follows: Pump 22050 gal pre-pad

Printect  11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



[(71/8/2007) Rachel Medina - FR 7P-36-14-19 CaMP.pdf

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 36- 14-S 19E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

' Description of Operations

9/25/2007 06:00 - 16:00

926/2007 06:00 - 16:00

9/27/2007 06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

PERF

SWAB

SWAB

followed by a 1500 gal pad and stage 1-4 ppg PRC 20/40 mesh sand in 4000 gals
of fluid and stage 4ppg 20/40 mesh PRC sand in 2500 gals of fiuid and flush with
8470 gals of fluid. The 1st half of flush was a60% quality foam followed by a water
cushion. Total of 43000# of 20/40 mesh PRC sand and atotal fiuid load of 440
bbls. Max rate = 32.5 BPM; avg rate = 27.8 BPM; max psi = 4869#% avg psi=
36604; ISIP = 3613# (.73). RD Stinger WH service and open the csg ona 18/64"
choke 1 hour later after the frac with a SICP = 1500#% Finish ROMO remaining
services. Continue to flow the well on various chokes overnight and &t 6:00 AMon
9/25/07 FCP = 50# ona 64/64" choke with alight trace of CQO2 and no fluid.
Recovered anest 235 bbls of water.

24 Hour Forecast: Wil continue to flow test or RIH with thg to clean out and swab.
LLTR: 205 bhls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
CsgDepth: 12468

Perfs:

Zane #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324’

12202' -~ 12300

TIGHT HOLEMI M

AL7:00 AMon 9/25/07 FCP = 0# ona full 2" line from Wingate perfs 12292' -
12324'. S csg for Thour and builtfo 100#.  Attempt to unload wellona full 2" line
to the pit and csg died in5 minutes. Pump 20bbis of 2% KCL water down the csg
for top kill. RIH w/ 2-3/8" thg as folllows: NC, 1.81" "F" Nipple &tbg. Tag @
12363,  Pull NC to 12248 with "F" Nipple @ 12215. RU swab. IFL @ 4100. Make
9swab runs and recovered 48 bbls of CO2 gas cut water. Tbg started to flow with
FFLat2000' and fina! SICP = 350%. Thg died in1/2 hour with no fiuid récovery.
SIFN. ON AMof 9/26/07 SITP = O# & SICP = S00#

24 Howr Forecast: Will continue to swab.
LLTR: 177 bhis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
CsgDepth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324’

12292' - 12300

TIGHT HOLENMn my

OnAM of 9/26/07 SITP = O# and SICP = 9004 RU swab. IFL @ 4000. Make 18
swab runs and recovered 77 bbls with FFL @ 5000 Thg started to flow water and
CO2 gas at 1:00 PMon afull 2" line with 25#. Continue to flow the thg overnight
and at5:00 AMon 9/27/07 thg was dead witha SICP = 900#, Recovered atotal of
260 bbls of water inthe last24 hours, At 7:00 AMon 9/27/07 FTP = dead and SICP
=950#% RU swab. IFL @ 7100.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab.& flow test.

Printec: 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



sage 71

Location:

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

36-14S 19E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

L_fate

: Frqm =To: ;1H®r5' E

912712007

9/28/2007

10/1/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

LLTR: 177 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

TIGHT HOLERIMMM it

Testing Wingate perfs 12202 - 12324,

OnAM of 9/27/07 FTP = O# and SICP = 900# RU swab. IFL @ 7100. Make 2
runs and thg started to flow after recovering 12 bbis of water. Tbg flowed for 2
hours and died with final SICP = = 650# and recavered an additional 16 bbis inthe
2hour flow period. RU swab. IFL @ 8700, Make 2runs and recovered 10bbls of
water and tbg flowed for 2 hours end died after flowing back 5 bbls of water with
finah SICP = 575% and recovering lite mist of CO2 with afrace of methane vapor.
RU swab. Make 1run with IFL @ 10,000' and flowing mist of same with final SICP
= 525# after a2-1/2 hour flow period and recovered an additional 13 bbls of water.
Turned well over to flow tester. Well flowed 1bbl inthe 1st hour with no recovery in
the next 11 hours. Si the tbg for a4 hour period and SITP went to 300# and bled off
immediately. At 7:00 AMon 9/28/07 FTP = Of and SICP = 7252,

24Howr Forecast: Will continue to swab.& flow test,
LLTR: 140 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth; 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324’

122¢82' - 12300

TIGHT HOLEmI 1l

Testing Wingate perfs 12202 - 12324'

OnAM of 9/26/07 FTP = O# & SICP = 725#. RU swab. IFL @ 4100 Make 4 runs
and recovered 22 bhis of water & thy started to flow with afinal SICP = 650# and
FFL@ 3400. Flowed for 2 hours and recovered. an additional 9 bbls of water and
tbg died. RU swab. IFL @ 7500, Make 3swab runs and tbg start to flow again
and recovered 12 bbls swabbing and 3 bbls fiowing for 1 hour. RU swab. IFL @
10,000" Make 1run and rec 3 bbls of water and thg flowed again for /2 hour and
RU swab. Make 1 additional run with IFL @ 10,000' while pulling from the "F"
Nipple @ 12215 tbg would not flow. SIFW. When tbg was flowing max psi was
25# ona full open 2" line. Final SICP = 500#4 Recovered afotal of 53 bbls of CO2
gas cut water with avery slight show of methane vapor.

24 Howr Forecast: Will POOH w/tbg & prepare for additional zones,
LLTR: 193 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
CsgDepth:  12468'

Printec: 11/6/2007 3:28:13 PM



11/812007) Rachel Medina - FR.

Eage 8

s

5

36- 148 19-E 26

10.00

10.00

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:

Rig Name: UNIT

1011/2007 06:00 - 16:00
10/3/2007 06:00 - 16:00
10/4/2007 06:00 - 16:00

10.00

SWAB

PERF

SwAB

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12282 - 12300

TIGHT HOLEmmm m

Testing Wingate perfs 12202' - 12324

On10/1/07 SITP = 1400# & SICP = 2000%. Bled down wellto 0% Pump 50 bbls of
2% KCL water to keep well dead, POOH witbg. SIFN. On 10/2/07 willset aCIBP
over the above perfs and perforate Entrada zones,

On10/2/07 SICP = 250%. MIRU Cutters WL and wireline set a5-1/2" CIBP @
12260" to shut off Wingate perfs 12202' - 12324 Perforate the following Entrada
intervals using a3-3/8" csg gun and “Power Pak" charges at3 JPF & 120* phasing
per the Dipole Sonic log dated 7/12/07: 11911' - 11913 11926’ - 11928} 11948 -
119625 11977 - 11979, 11987' - 11989, 11902 - 11994' & 12068 - 12070 (48
holes). IFL &FFL @ 6500. ISICP = 2504, FSICP = 300% RDMG Cutters WL.
Tagged CIBP prior o perforating. Bled off csg. RIH w/2-3/8" collar; 1jt of tbg;
1.81" "F"Nipple and 364 jts of thy to surface. Land fhg inhanger at 11889 and "F"
Nipple @ 11835. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will start testing gross perforated Entradainterval 11911 -
12070

LLTR: 193 bhis over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
CsgDepth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12282 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068 - 12070

11992 - 11994'

11987" - 11989

1977 - 11979

11948 - 11952

11626' - 11928

11911 - 11813

TIGHT HOLEMN 1t

Testing Wingate perfs 11913 -~ 12070.

OnAM of 10/3/07 SITP = 450# and SICP = 400%. Bled off tbg with no fluid
recovery. RU swab, IFL @ 4800. Make 19swab runs and recovered 106 bbls of
water with notrace of methane but with light gas ~~probably leftover CO2, FFL @
9600 with afinal SICP = 325# with no apparent fluid entry. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab the above Entrada perfs.

LLTR: 51 bbls

Printed: 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



(11/8/2007) Rachel Medina - FR 7P-36-

Bage 9]

Location:

10/5/2007

10/8/2007

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

36- 148 19-E 26

Rig Name: UNIT

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00 10,00

06:00 - 16:00 10.00

SWAB

SWAB

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324’

12282' - 12300'

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068 - 12070

11992' - 11984

11987 - 11889

1977 - 11979

1148 - 11852

11926' - 11928

11911 - 11913

TIGHT HOLEmmmttt 1

Testing Enfrada perfs 11913' - 12070,

On 10/4/07 SITP = 550# & SICP = 700#. Bled off tbg with no fiid recovery, RU
swab. IFL @ 9200, Make 2swab runs and rec 11 bbls of water withafinal SICP=
650# &FFL @ 5600. Thy flowed for 1 hour and flowed back 3 bbls of water ona
full open 2" line and thg died with afinal SICP = 350# RU swab. Tag "F"Nipple at
11835" with no fiuid evident and sand line parted when starting out of hole. POOH
wiih sand fine and missing bottom 300" of line and tools. Bled off csgto 04 POOH
withtbg and layed down parted sand line. RIH with thg to 8300' and SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will confinue to RIH with thg and land and return to swabbing.
LLTR: 37 bbls

Csy Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12282' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Enfrada on 10/2/07
12088 - 12070

11992' - 11904'

11987" - 11989

11977" - 11979

11948' -~ 11952

11926' - 11928

T - 11913

TIGHT HOLEMmmtH 11t

Testing Entrada perfs 11913’ - 12070.

On 10/5/07 SITP = 400# and SICP = 375#. Bled off well with no fluid recovery.
Continue to RIH withtbg and fand tbg tail inthe hanger at11869' and "F" Nipple at

Printed: 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



1€ 17872007) Rachel Medina - FR 7P-36-14-19 CBMF'-".pdf

Bage 101

Location:

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

36- 148 19E 26

Rig Name: UNIT

10/8/2007

10/9/2007

10/10/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 ~ 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number; 236

oription of Operations

11835, RUswab. IFL @ "F" nipple @ 11835. Make 2 runs and both runs were
dry with final SICP = 1504 Make 2 hourly runs to the "F" Nipple and both runs were
dry. RDswab & SIFW.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab test.
LLTR: 37 bhis

Csg Size: 5-1/2° 17# P-110
Csg Depth; 12468"

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2Enirada on 10/2/07
12068 - 12070

11992' - 11994'

11987 - 1198¢

77 - 1979

1948 - 11952

11626' - 11928

M1 - 11913

TIGHT HOLEMIN M

Testing Entrada perfs 11913' - 12070.

OnAM of 10/8/07 SITP = 2000# & SICP = 1800#% Bled off thy with no fiuid recovery
in 3 hours with final SICP = 2254 RU swab. RIH to "F" Nipple @ 11835 with no
fluid level and no recovery. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Wil acidize the Entrada perfs.
LLTR: 37 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Enlrada on 10/2/07
12008' - 12070

11962'°- 11994

11987 - 11989

1977 - 11979

11948 - 11952

11926' - 11928

1911' - 1113

TIGHT HOLENm 1t

Printed: 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



[(117872007) Rachel Medina

7P-36-14-19 COMP.pdi

F’age 111

Location:
Rig Name:

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

36-14-S 19E 26

UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

From - To |

1010/2007

10/11/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

SWAB

Testing Entrada perfs 11913' - 12070,
On10/9/07 SITP = 500#%, SICP = 550%. Bled off well with no fluid recovery. Fill and
circ hole with 2% KCL water. MIRU Halliburton acid crew and acidize gross
perforated Entrada perfs 11813 - 12070' down tbg as follows: Pump 10 bbls of 2%
KCL water and obtain break at4915#. Open csgand circ1000 gals of 15% HCL
with 75 - 7/8" Bio-balls to within 2000° of perfs and Sl csg and pump the acid and
balls into the perfs with limited ball action (20-30#) breaks and flush with 71 bbis of
2% KCL water, Max rate = 5,9 BPM, avg rate = 4.7 BPM; max psi = 40154 ISIP =
10504 (0.52). After 15 minutes SITP = 4804 RDMO Halliburton. Open thy after
20 minutes and tbg dead. RU swab. IFL @ surface. Make 21swab runs and
recovered 113 bbls of water with acld gas and final pH of 6. FFL @ 2400, Final
SICP = vacuum. With csg volume and acid and flush valume have 197 bbls LLTR.
RD swab. SIFN. On AMof 10/10/07 SITP = 400% & SICP = 700#,

24 Hour Forecast: Wil corfinue to swabfflow the above perfs,
LLTR: 197 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth; 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12088 - 12070

11992' - 11994

11987 - 11889

11977 - 11979

11948 -~ 11952

11926' - 11928’

1911° - 11913

TIGHT HOLEMMINm ny

Testing Entrada perfs 11913' - 12070

OnAM of 10/10/07 SITP = 400# and SICP = 700# Bled off tog with no fluid
recovery, RU swab, IFL @ 3100. Make 4 swab runs wiih FFLat 1800 with SICP
= 600# and thg started to flow after recovereing 40bbls of water. Flow test the well
from 8:45 AMon 10/10/07 for the rest ofthe day and night and continue to flow test
on AM of 10/11/07 and @ 8:00 AMon 10/11/07 FTP = 100# ona 32/64" choke with
aSICP = 350# and currently dry gas for the last 4 howrs and have recovered inthe
last 25 howrs atotal of 181 bbls of water withanest LLTR of 16 bbis.

24 Hour Forecast: Will confinue to flow test.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316 - 12324

Printed:  11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



5age 1§'ﬂ

Location:

Date

Rig Name: UNIT

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

36- 148 19E 26

10/11/2007

10/12/2007

10/19/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

PTST

OTH

Spud Date;  2/5/2007
Rig Release:  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

12202 - 12300
Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068 - 12070
11992' - 11994’
11987' - 11989
17T - 11979
11948" - 11952
11926 - 11628
11917 - 11913

TIGHT HOLENmmm 1

Testing Entrada perfs 11913 - 12070'

On AM of 10/11/07 FTP = 100# ona 32/64" choke with a SICP = 350¢ and flowing
dry gas, Continue to flow the welltothe pitona 32/64" choke for the last 24 hours
and 2t 7:00 AMon 10/12/07 FTP = 100# ona 32/64" choke with a SICP = 350# and
dry gas and to have recovered 1bbl ofwater inthe last 24 hours. Opened the tby
several times during the last 24 hours ona full 2° line o unload and no fluid arrived.
Will continue fo flow the well early this AMand then run BHP bombs for the next 7
days.

24 Hour Forecast: Wil continue to flow test & then run BHP bombs for the next 7
days..

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Peifs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316" - 12324'

12292' - 12300

Final Weter = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
120688 - 12070

11992' - 11904’

11987 - 11989

1977" - 11979

11948 - 11952

11926' - 11928’

111" - 11913

TIGHT HOLERMNM 1

Testing Entrada perfs 11913' - 12070

On10/12/07 FTP= 100# ona 32/64" choke witha SICP = 350# at7:00 AMand
flowing dry gas tothe pit. MIRU PLS wireline and soft set tandem BHP bombs in
the "F" Nipple at 11835' with bombs inthe "F" Nipple at 11838 with bombs set at
11:00 AM. Continue to flow the tbg ona 32/64" choke for an additional 4 hours with
afinal FTP = 100# and afinal SICP = 325#% with nofluid rec. and nowater inthe last
24 hours. Sl the well at3:00 PMon 10/12/07 and weli will remain Sl until the bombs
are pulled AMof 10/19/07. Report discontinued until bombs are pulled.

24 Hour Forecast: Report discontinued until bombs are pulled,

Printec: 11/6/2007 8:25:13 PM



T’ége 1§'ﬁ

36-14S 19E 26

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:

Rig Name: UNIT

10/19/2007  §06:00 ~ 16:00
10222007 |08:00 - 16:00
10/23/2007  |06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

OTH

BOP

PERF

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Csg Size: 512" 17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12202 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zore #2 Enfrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' ~ 11994

11987" - 11989

ne77 - 11979

11948 - 11952

11926° - 11928

1MAN1 - 11N

TIGHT HOLEMI u
Testing Entrada perfs, 11913-12070

OnAM of 10/19/07 SITP and SICP=2400#. RIH with PLS and latch onto BHP
bombs in"F" nipple and POOH with bombs making gradient stops onthe way out of
hole. Left well SIFW. On 10/22/07. will bleed well down and POOH with thg.to
prepare to perforate additional intervals,

Csg Sizer 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

LLTR: 15

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12262' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbis over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994

11887 - 11989

1877 - 11979

11948 - 11952

11926 - 11928

11917 - 11913

TIGHT HOLEMHin®Y Mt
Testing Enfrada perfs, 11913-12070'

OnAM of 10/22/07 SITP=2500# and SICP=2550# Bled off well and pump 20 bbl.of
2% KCL water down tbg.to kill. POOH with tbg.and SIFN. On 10-23-07 will
perforate additional Entrada zones.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Printed; 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM
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age 141

Location:

10/23/2007

10/24/2007

10/25/2007

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

36-14S 19E 26

Rig Name: UNIT

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Rig Release: 5/10/2007

Rig Number: 236

PERF

PERF

STIM

&

Load from yesterday: 15
Plus water today: 20
LLTR: 35

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' -~ 12324’

12202 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Enfrada on 10/2/07
12068 -~ 1207

11902" - 11994

11987" - 11989

11977 - 11979

11948 - 11952

11926 - 11928

11911" - 11913’

TIGHT HOLEmI 11y
Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830-12070'

On AM of 10/23/07 SICP=1500#, MIRU Cutters WAL and perforate the following
Entrada intervals &t 3 JPF using a3-3/8" csg.gun and 120" phasing per the
Schiumberger Dipole Sonic log dated 7/12/07: 11830-11844' ( 42 holes). and
11851-11868 (51 holes). Final SICP =1500# Holewas basically empty of fluids.
RDMO Cutters WL, Bled off csg..RIH with 1]t oftbg; 1.81" "F" nipple and thg.to
6800. SIFN. On 10/24/07 willcontinue to RIH with thg.and acidize all Entrada
perfs. together.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Load from yesterday: 35
Plus water today: 50
LLTR: 85

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 -~ 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2Entrada on 10/2/07
12068 - 1207¢'

11992 - 11994

11887" - 11989

11977 - 1197¢

11948 - 11952

11926 - 11928

11911' - 11913

Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07): 1183044 11851-68'
TIGHT HOLEImM il

Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830° - 12070,

Printed: 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



Page 151

Location:

Well Name: FR

7P-36-14-19

36- 14-S 19-E 26

Rig Name: UNIT

10/25/2007

10/26/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

STIM

STIM

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

., Description of Operati
On AM of 10/24/07 SITP = 850# and SICP = 900# Bled down thg & pump 60 bbls
of water down the thg. (Continue to RIH with thg & land thg tail @ 11803’ &"F"
Nipple @ 11770. MIRU Halliburion Acid Crew & acidize gross perforated Entrada
perfs 11830' to 12070' as follows: Load hole and obtain break down the thg at
643%. Pump 20 bbis of 2% KCL water with §0- 7/8" Bio-balls and pump 1000 gals
of 16% HCLwith 150 - 7/8" Bio-Balls and flush the tbg with 71 bbis of 2% KCL.
water. Max rate = 4.8 BPM & avg rate = 4.4 BPM; max psi = 4070#, avg psi=
3236#, ISIP = 994%. 15 minutes = 647# Had limited ball action. Total load to
recover including past foad and csgload and pump load is 525 bhls. RPMO
Halliburton, Open tbg to pit and flowed back 6 bbls of water and died. RU swab.
IFL @ surface. Make atotal of 14 swab runs and recovered 82bbls of water for a
total of 88 bbls recovered withafinal pH = 8and nogas and Offinal SICP. FFL @
3400. RD swaband SIFN. On AMof 10/25/07 SITP & SICP = 0#.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab,
LLTR: 437 bhls

Csg Size: 51/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over

Zone #2 Enfrada on 10/2/07

12068' - 12070

1992 - 11994’

11987 - 1198¢

M77 - 1979

11948 - 11952

11926' - 11928

1911' - 11913

Additional Entrada perfs:

(10/23/07):

11830-447 11851-68'

TIGHT HOLEMIm! uy

Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830 - 12070,
On 10/25/07 SITP & SICP = 0#. RU swab. IFL @ 3100. Make 23 swab runs and

r 120 bbis of water with med. gas onthe last@runs and FFL @ 4900 w/
final SICP = 225#. Final pH = 8. RD swaband SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab,
LLTR: 307 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324'

Printect  11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM
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Page 16 4

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 36-14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

R P

10/26/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00

10/29/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00

10/30/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00

STIM

SWAB

SWAB

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over

Zone #2 Enirada on 10/2/07

12068 - 12070

11902' - 11994

11987 - 11989

1977 - 11979

11948 - 11962

11926 - 11928

Mot - 11913

Additional Entrada perfs:

(10/23/07):

11830-44; 11851-68'

TIGHT HOLENHm nit

Testing Entrada gross perforated irterval 11830 - 12070 .

On 10/26/07 SITP = 1200# and SICP = 1050# Bled off tbg. RU swab. IFL @
3300. Make 18runs and recovered 94 bbls of med gas cut water withafinal pH=8
and afinal SICP = 925# witha FFL @ 3100. RD swab & SIFWE.

24 Hour Forecast:
LLTR: 213 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over

Zone #2 Entrada  on 10/2/07

12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994

11987' - 11989

M7 - 11979

11948' - 11952

11926 - 11928

11911° - 11918

Additional Entrada perfs:

(10/23/07):

11830-44% 11851-68'

TIGHT HOLEnHMN nit

Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830 - 12070,

On 10/20/07 SITP = 1850# and SICP = 2000# Bled off tbg with no fluid recovery.
RU swab. IFL @ 3700". Make 3runs and thg started to flow after recovering 23
bbis of med gas cutwater and FFL @ 2400' and SICP = 1900# Flowed the tbg for
8hours ona full 2" line with afinal FTP = 25# with a final FTP = 254 with a final
SICP = 650# and recovering 1 BPH the last 2 hours withafinal pH = 7 and atotal
recovery foday between flowing and swabbing of 121 bbis. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will resume swabbing/fiowing .

Printect  11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



Location:

10/30/2007

10/31/2007

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

36-14S 19E 26

Rig Name: UNIT

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

LLTR: 92 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth:  12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1; Wingate

12316 - 12324

12282' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over

Zone #2 Enfrada on 10/2/07

12068' - 12070

11992 - 11994’

11987 -~ 11989

1977 - 1197¢

11948 - 11952

11926' - 11928

11911 - 1913

Additional Ertrada perfs:

(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68

TIGHT HOLENmI 1t

Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830 - 12070

On10-30-07 SITP=1800# and SICP=2000# Bled off tbg.and flowed back 28 bbl.of
gas cut water with afinal SICP=250# and flowed the thg.for atotal of 5 hours with
the last 4 hours dry gas and afinal FTP=75# ona 32/64" choke. RU swab. IFL. at
8700, Recovered 4 bbl.off water and thg.flowed for 1 hour with 2 additional bbl.of
gas cut water with aninitial SICP 550# and final SICP=400# with a FTP=50# ona
full 2" line. RIH again with swab with nofluid tag and no recovery of fluid. S| the
well at 3:00PM with afinal FTP=75# ona full 2" line wihtafinal SICP=350% Total
recovered today of 34 bbl..On 10/31/07 willcheck pressures and blow well down
and start to prepare for upcoming frac.

Load from yesterday: 92
Minus daily recovery: -34
LLTR: 58

Csg Size: 512" 174 P-110
CsgDepth:  12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324’

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bhls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994

11887" -~ 11989

1877 - 11979

11948 - 11952

11926" - 11928

11817 - 13

Printed: 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM




(11/8/2007) Rachel Medina - FR 7P-36-14-19 COMP.pdf

UNIT

10/31/2007 06:00 - 16:00
1111/2007 06:00 - 16:00
11/2/2007 0600 - 16:00

Welli Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:
Rig Name:

36- 148 19E 26

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB |1
OTH
TRP 5

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Additional Erfrada perfs:
(10/23/07):

11830-44" 11851-68'
TIGHT HOLEMIIMM i Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830 ~ 12070.
On 10/30/07 SITP & SICP = 18004 Open the tbg tothe pit for 8 hours and the final
FTP = 25# and the final SICP = 450# ona 32/64" choke and recovered 2 bbls of
water. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will pull thg and prepare for frac work.

Load from yesterday: 58
Minus daily recovery: -2
LLTR: 56

Csg Size: 5-1/2° 174 P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over

Zone #2 Enfrada on 10/2/07

12068 - 12070

11992 - 11994

11987 - 11989

177 - 11979

11948 - 11952

11926' - 11928

11911 - 11913

Additional Enfrada perfs:

(10/23/07):

11830-44% 11851-68

TIGHT HOLENMIM ' Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830' - 12070
On14/1/07 SITP & SICP = 1950#. Bled off well and pump 20bbls 0f 2% KCL water
down the thg to kill well. POOH w/ibg. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Wil start to move in equipment for fracs on 11/3/07.
LLTR: 76 bbls

Csg Size: 5-12" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12816 - 12324

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 183 bhls over
Zone #2 Enfrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994

11987 - 11989

Printed:  11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM
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Location:

Rig Name: UNIT

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

36- 148 19E 26

11/5/2007

06:00 - 16:00

1000

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release;  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

escription of Operations

TRP

STiv

1977 - 11979
11948 - 11952
11926' - 11928
MAT - 11913
Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):
11830-44; 11851-68
TIGHT HOLEMHIm ny
On11/2/07 SICP = 1500#. Opén csg and bled off well fo flow test, Flow tested for
3howrs ona 32/64" and had nofluid recovery with afinal FCP = 1004 SI the well.
MIRU Cutters WL & Stinger WH Services to prepare for frac work.
On 11/3/07 - MIRU Halliburton Frac Crew & left well Slto prepare for work on
11/4/07,
On11/4/07 - SICP = 1880# Frac gross perforated Entrada interval 11830° - 12070'
down 5-1/2" esg using a35# Hybor2% KCL x-linked gel water system with 70% N2
as follows: Pump 212200 gal pad and stage 1-4 20/40 mesh Ceramic sand in
27000 gals of fluid and stage a4 ppg stage in 5700 gals of fiud and flush with 11579
gals of fluid. Total of 90600# ofsand and atotal fluidload of 544 bbl. Total of 1671
MSCF N2, Max rate = 57.7 BPM, avg rate = 40.25 BPM; max psi = 5211% avg psi
= 4720, ISIP = 30754 (.69). Lubricate ina 5-1/2" comp frac plug and set at 11550
Perforate per the Schiumberger Dipole Soric log dated 7/12/07 the following
intervals at 3 JPF and 120" phasing using 23-3/8" csg gun adn "Power Pak"
charges as follows: Dakota: 10888-90; Cedar Min: 10918-28; & 10946-50' (48
total holes). Frac the Dakota/Cedar Min gross interval 10888-10950' down csg
using the above system as follows: Pump a 12700 gal pad and stage 1-4 ppg 20/40
PRC sand in 27,000 gals of fluid and pump a4 ppg stage in5600 gals of fluid and
flush with 11170 gals of fiuid. Total of 589 bbls and atotal of 95000# of sand. Max
rate = 45 BPM; avg rate = 38,5 BPM; max psi = 6324#%, avg psi = 5852# ISIP =
5374# (.93). Lubricate ina comp frac plug & set @ 10800. Perforate Dakota Silt
interval: 10742-58 (48 holes) per the above log and gun. Frac Dakota Silt interval
10742-58' down csg using the above system as follows: Pump a5000 gal pad and
stage 1-420/40 mesh PRC sand in 12000 gals of fluid and flush followed by a 4 ppg
stage in4700 gals of fluid and flush with 11000 gals of fluid. Total of 370004 of
sand and atotal of 370 bbls. Mex rate =433 BPM; avg rate = 35 BPM, max psi =
4200%;, avg psi = 5635% ISIP = 5097# {.91). Total LLTR = 1503 bhls. RDMO
Hallilburton & Cutters WL. Attempt to release Stinger Isolation Teol and had
hydraulic problems. Released tool at4:15 AMon 11/6/07 and move out Stinger.
Open the csg &t 4:30 AMon 11/5/07 with SICP = 43504 At 7:00 AMon 11/5/07
FCP = 2125# on a 24/64" choke ata current rate est at 60 BPH of N2 water for an
est fotal 0f210 bhls recovered. Continue to flow well tothe pit to ciean up.
NOTE: On the Dakota/Cedar M frac used atotal of 1568 MSCF and onthe
Dakota Silt used 837 SCF N2.

24 Hour Forecast: Continue toflow welltothe pit to clean up.
LLTR: 1369 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
CsgDepth: 12468

Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316 -~ 12324'

Printed: 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM
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Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:  36- 148 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release:  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

| T eai | Sub! e

11/5/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 | STIM

11/6/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 [ PTST

3

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over

Zone #2 Enfrada on 10/2/07

12068 - 12070

11902 - 11994'

11987 - 11989

1977 - 1197¢'

11848' - 11952

11926' - 11928

11911 - 11913

Additional Entrada perfs:

(10/23/07):

11830-44, 11851-68

Dakota:

10888-90"

Cedar Min:

10918-28'

10946-50'

Dakota Silt:

10742-58'

TIGHT HOLEUIMM 1t

At7.00 AMon 11/5/07 FCP = 2125# ona 24/64" choke atan est rate of 60 BPH of
N2water. Continue to flow the well for the next 23-1/2 hours and at6:30 AMon
11/6/07 FCP = 1400# ona 24/64" choke with anest huorly rate of 20 BPH with med
methane gas and anest recovery inthe last 23-1/2 hours of 605 bbls.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to flow the well to the pit to clean up well.
LLTR: 734 bhis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bhls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068 - 12070

11992 - 11994’

11987 - 1198¢

1977 - 11979

11948 - 11952

11926' - 11928

11911 - 11913

Additional Entrada perfs: .
{10/23/07):

11830-44, 11851-68
Dakota:

10888-90'

Cedar Min:

10918-28'

Printed: 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM



Bage 211

Rig Name: UNIT

11/6/2007 06:00 - 16:00

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location: 36- 14-S 19-E 26

10.00

PTST

Spud Dater  2/5/2007
Rig Release:  5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

10946-50'
Dakota Silt:
10742-58'

Printed: 11/6/2007 3:23:13 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  S614=3—48-E-26— Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT 1 L\. S a: E 5}\ Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
8/17/2007  |06:00 -16:00 |  10.00| BOP |1 TIGHT HOLEM!

Initial completion of well. Schlumberger WL ran Dipole Sonic and CBL logs on this
well on 7/12 & 7/13/07.

On 8/13/07 - MIRU Basin Well Service to start completion of well. ND WH & NU
10K# BOP and flowback manifold. SIFN.

On 8/14/07 - tally and rabbit in the hole with a 4-3/4" bit, 5-1/2" csg scraper and new
2-3/8" EUE 8rd 4.7# P-110 tbg tc 10400'. Checked drag every 500' and had 7000#
over pull at 10400' and rotating with power swivel with 1000# torque. Circ hole
clean with 2% KCL water & SIFN.

On 8/15/07 - Continue to tally and rabbit in the hole as above. Tag at 12400" and
circ down to 12414'. Check for drag and had 12M to 15M# drag off bottom. Circ
hole clean with 2% KCL water. POOH with tbg & bit & scraper. SIFN.

On 8/16/07 - MIRU Quick Test and test csg. BOP's and flowback manifold to 9000#
and held OK. MIRU Cutters WL and perforate the foliowing intervals at 3 JPF using
a 3-3/8" csg gun and "Power Pak" charges. Wingate: 12292' - 12300' & 12316’ -
12324' (48 holes) per the Dipole Sonic log dated 7/12/07. Hole was full of 2% KCL
water prior to perforating and on a slight vacuum after perforation. RDMO Cutters
WL & SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: On 8/17/07 will RIH with tbg and start to swab well down.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292' - 12300

8/20/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( TRP 2 TIGHT HOLE!!

On 8/17/07 SICP = vacuum. RIH with tbg as follows: All tbg is 2-3/8" EUE 8rd
P-110 4.7#; collar; 1 jt; 1.81" "F" Nipple at 378 jts to surface. Tbg tail @ 12258' &
"F" Nipple @ 12224'. Tbg above all perfs. RU swab. IFL @ surface. Make 12
swab runs & recovered 88 bbls of water with no gas and no fluid entry. FFL @
4000". SD for weekend due to lightning. SIFW.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab well.
LLTR = 178 bbls. (left over csg volume).

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300"

8/21/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB (1 TIGHT HOLEH ey

On 8/20/07: SICP=125# SITP=vac: RIH w/swab IFL @ 4000'. Made 25 swab runs
and recovered 113 bbls of water showing light gas with no fluid entry. FFI @ 9200
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

8/21/2007

8/22/2007

8/23/2007

8/24/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06.00 - 16.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

SICP of 125# SIFN
On 8/21/07 will continue to swab well. Est. load left to rec. 65 bblis

Load from yesterday: 178
Minus daily recovery: 113
LLTR: 65

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316 - 12324
12292' - 12300’
TIGHT HOLEY
On 8/21/07, SICP = 275#, SITP = 300#. Blow tbg to 0 psi - Full/Open. Rec 0 bbls.
RIH w/ swab. IFL @ 8550'. Made 19 swab runs. Rec 66 bbls of water showing
light gas with no fluid entry for final 3 hours. FFL @ 11,600". Csg = 350#. Have rec
1 bbl overload.

24 Hour Forecast: Will check fluid level & break down perfs with 1000 gals of 15%
& 72 Bio-balls.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316 - 12324'
12292' - 12300

On 8/22/07 - SICP = 500#, SITP = 400#. Blow tbg down to 0 psi full/open. RIH w/
swab tag FL @ 11,500'. POOH w/ swab. Blow csg down to O psi full/open. Loaded
hole w/ 280 bbls 2% KCL. RU Halliburton and broke down perfs @ 12292' - 12324
with 1000 gals of 15% HCL acid & 72 Bio-balls. Got break @ 3551#. Had max
pressure of 4500#, avg pressure of 4000#. Max rate of 4.6 BPM, avg rate = 4.5
BPM, ISIP = 1600#%. Total load of 97 bbls. RD Halliburton. Open well up w/ 800#.
Blow to 0 psi full/open. Rec 20 bbls. RIH w/ swab. IFL @ surface. Made 23 swab
runs. Rec 135 bbls (155 bbis total). Showing lite gas with 14 bbls fluid entry for last
hour. FFL @ 3800". Csg=0psi. pH=7. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab well.
LLTR: 222 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324’
12292' - 12300'

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:18 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26

Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code (%‘dbe Description of Operations

8/24/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( SWAB |1 On 8/23/07, SICP = 225¢#, SITP = 350#. Blow tbg down to 0 psi full/open. Rec 0
bbls. RIH w/swab. IFL @ 3350". Made 16 swab runs. Rec 73 bbls water.
Showing med gas. FFL @ 1200". pH = 7. Start flowing w/ 25# tbg pressure.
Full/open & 350# csg pressure. Rec 38 bbls water. Open csg up @ 2:00 PM. Blow
to 0 psi full/open wouldn't flow. Tbg pressure down to 0#. SIFN.
24 Hour Forecast: Will try to flow up csg & continue to swab well.
LLTR: 111 bbls
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324
12292 - 12300°

8/27/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00{ SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE!
On 8/24/07 SITP = 1350# & SICP = 1250#. Open tbg on a 22/64" choke and bled
off to 0# in 45 minutes. Attempt to flow csg to establish flow rate and bled off csg to
50# in 1 hr on a 22/64" choke with no fluid recovery. SI csg. Open tbg on a full 2"
line to the flow back tank and recovered 20 bbls of slight gas cut water in 1 hr and
an additional 10 bbls in 1/2 hour and tbg dead. Open up the 9P csg and equalize
over to 7P csg to 1800#. Open tbg with SICP = 1750# and recovered 15 bbls of
water and tbg died. RU swab. IFL @ 3850". Make 14 swab runs and recovered an
additional 45 bbls of slight to med gas cut water with FFL at 2300 and finat SICP =
1700' but tbg would not sustain a flow. RD swab & SIFW. Recovered a total of 90
bbls of water today with an est LLTR = 21 bbis.
24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab well in.
LLTR: 21 bbls
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316 - 12324'
12292 - 12300

8/29/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE!ttnnnnm

On 8/27/07 SITP = 1300# & SICP = 24004 with 1900# of SICP still left on the csg
from 9P well. Open tbg on a 36/64" choke and bled off csg to 0#. RU swab. IFL @
3850#. Make 3 swab runs and recovered 21 bbls of gas cut water with FFL @
1800 and final SICP = 2100#. Tbg started to flow. Flowed the tbg for 7-1/2 hours
with a final FTP = 30# on a 28/64" choke with final SICP = 625# with no fluid
recovery the last 1/2 hour with a total recovery between swabbing and flowing of 59
bbls. Appears tbg is loading up. SIFN. Have recovered 38 bbls over load.

On 8/28/07 SITP = 1350# and SICP = 1700#. Open tbg on a 28/64" choke and bied
dead in 1/2 hour. RU swab. IFL @ 200'. Make 1 run and recovered 6 bbls of water
and tbg started to flow with SICP = 1700#. Open tbg full open for 15 minutes to
unload tbg and placed tbg on a 18/64" choke with a final FTP = 450# and a final
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code Csolijbe Description of Operations
8/29/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 SICP = 825# after recovering a total of 14 bbls of water and final flow of dry gas.

MIRU PLS WL and ran tandem BHP bombs and flowed the tbg for 3 hours on a
18/64" chooke with no additional fluid recovery and final FTP = 10# and final SICP =
775#. Land bombs with soft-set in "F” Nipple at 12224' with well Sl at 2:00 PM on
8/28/07. Well will remain St until bombs are pulled on Tuesday, 9/4/07. Have
recovered a total of 52 bbls over load.

LLTR: 52 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468*

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324’

12282' - 12300°

9/5/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLERIHnnn

ON AM of 9/4/07 SITP = 1800# and SICP = 2250#. MI PLS and pull BHP bombs
and with bombs out of hole at 2:00 PM on 9/4/07. RDMO Basin Well Service. Well
will remain Sl until further notice. RDUFA.

LLTR: 52 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300

9/11/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00(LOC 4 TIGHT HOLEN

Resumption of completion. On 9/10/07 MIRU Basin Well Service to continue
completion of well. SITP = 1900# and SICP = 2400#. Left well SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will flow/swab test.
LLTR: 52 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300°

9/12/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE!! i

On 9/11/07 SITP = 1900# and SICP = 24004. Bled off tbg on a 36/64" choke and
had no fluid recovery. RU swab. IFL @ 700". Make 1 run and recovered 4 bbls of
water and tbg started to flow. Flow tbg for 3 hours on a 48/64" choke with a final
SICP = 450# and recovered 46 bbls of water with a final FTP = 25#. No fluid
recovery the last hour. RURU swab. IFL @ 8200". Make 4 swab runs with FFL @
11400 while pulling from the “F" nipple with a hourly entry rate of 3 BPH of gas cut
water and final SICP = 350#. Recovered a total of 61 bbls of water today. RD
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From-To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

9/12/2007

9/13/2007

9/14/2007

9/25/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

OTH

PERF

swab. SIFN.
24 Hour Forecast: Will swab/flow test.
LLTR: 113 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324’
12292" - 12300

On 9/12/07, SITP = 1300# & SICP = 1500#. Bled off tbg in 2-1/2 hours and
recovred 4 bbls of water with final SICP = 450#. RU swab. IFL. @ 11400". Make 8
swab runs and recovered an additional 8 bbls of slight gas cut water with FFL @
12000" while pulling from the "F" Nipple at 12220' and making 2 runs per hour with a
recovery of 1 BPH. Recovered a total of 12 bbis of water today with final SICP =
250#. RD swab. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will swab/flow test.
LLTR: 125 bbls over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316" - 12324’
12292' - 12300

On 9/13/07 SICP and SITP=1200#. Bled off tbg.to 50# and recovered 3 bbl.of
water. Bled off csg.and tbg.to 0#. POOH with all tbg..Install lower blind rams and S
the well. This report is suspended pending frac scheduling of this zone.

Load from yesterday: 125 over
Minus daily recovery: 3
LLTR: 128 over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324'
12292' - 12300

Resumption of report discontinued on 9/14/07. On AM of 9/24/07 SICP = 1900#.
MIRU Halliburton frac crew, Stinger WH Services & Praxair CO2 gas. Frac gross
perforated Wingate intervals 12292' - 12324' down csg using a 70% quality 40#
Purgell 2% KCL x-linked gel water system as follows: Pump a 2050 gal pre-pad
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code (?c:‘dbe Description of Operations

9/25/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| PERF |2 followed by a 1500 gal pad and stage 1-4 ppg PRC 20/40 mesh sand in 4000 gals
of fluid and stage 4 ppg 20/40 mesh PRC sand in 2500 gals of fluid and flush with
8470 gals of fluid. The 1st half of flush was a 60% quality foam followed by a water
cushion. Total of 43000# of 20/40 mesh PRC sand and a total fluid load of 440
bbls. Max rate = 32.5 BPM; avg rate = 27.8 BPM; max psi = 4869#; avg psi =
3660#; ISIP = 3613# (.73). RD Stinger WH service and open the csg on a 18/64"
choke 1 hour later after the frac with a SICP = 15004. Finish RDMO remaining
services. Continue to flow the well on various chokes overnight and at 6:00 AM on
9/25/07 FCP = 50# on a 64/64" choke with a light trace of CO2 and no fluid.
Recovered an est 235 bbis of water.
24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to flow test or RIH with tbg to clean out and swab.
LLTR: 205 bbis
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316 - 12324’
12292' - 12300

9/26/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE iy
At 7:00 AM on 9/25/07 FCP = 0# on a full 2" line from Wingate perfs 12292' -
12324'. Sl csg for 1 hour and built to 100#. Attempt to unload well on a full 2" Jine
to the pit and csg died in 5 minutes. Pump 20 bbls of 2% KCL water down the csg
for top kill. RIH w/ 2-3/8" tbg as folllows: NC, 1.81" "F" Nipple & tbg. Tag @
12363'. Pull NC to 12248' with "F" Nipple @ 12215'. RU swab. IFL @ 4100". Make
9 swab runs and recovered 48 bbls of CO2 gas cut water. Tbg started to flow with
FFL at 2000 and final SICP = 350#. Tbg died in 1/2 hour with no fluid recovery.
SIFN. ON AM of 9/26/07 SITP = 0# & SICP = S00#.
24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab.
LLTR: 177 bbls
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324'
12292' - 12300'

9/27/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1

On AM of 9/26/07 SITP = O# and SICP = 900#. RU swab. IFL @ 4000". Make 18
swab runs and recovered 77 bbls with FFL @ 5000'. Tbg started to flow water and
CO2 gas at 1:00 PM on a full 2" line with 25#. Continue to flow the tbg overnight
and at 5:00 AM on 9/27/07 tbg was dead with a SICP = 900#. Recovered a total of
260 bbis of water in the ast 24 hours. At 7:00 AM on 9/27/07 FTP = dead and SICP
=950#. RU swab. IFL @ 7100".

24 Hour Farecast: Will continue to swab.& flow test.
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code Csol:jbe Description of Operations
9/27/2007  |06:00-16:00 | 10.00| SWAB |1 LLTR: 177 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292' - 12300

9/28/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00{ SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE!Mmnmmn

Testing Wingate perfs 12292' - 12324'.

On AM of 9/27/07 FTP = 0# and SICP = 900#. RU swab. IFL @ 7100". Make 2
runs and tbg started to flow after recovering 12 bbls of water. Tbg flowed for 2
hours and died with final SICP = = 650# and recovered an additional 16 bbls in the
2 hour flow period. RU swab. IFL @ 8700'. Make 2 runs and recovered 10 bbls of
water and tbg flowed for 2 hours end died after flowing back 5 bbis of water with
final SICP = 575# and recovering lite mist of CO2 with a trace of methane vapor.
RU swab. Make 1 run with IFL @ 10,000' and flowing mist of same with final SICP
= 525¢# after a 2-1/2 hour flow period and recovered an additionat 13 bbis of water.
Turned well over to flow tester. Well flowed 1 bbl in the 1st hour with no recovery in
the next 11 hours. Sl the tbg for a 4 hour period and SITP went to 300# and bled off
immediately. At 7:00 AM on 9/28/07 FTP = 0# and SICP = 725#.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab.& flow test.
LLTR: 140 bbis over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300

10/1/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE!nnn

Testing Wingate perfs 12292' - 12324,

On AM of 9/28/07 FTP = 0# & SICP = 725#. RU swab. IFL @ 4100'. Make 4 runs
and recovered 22 bbls of water & tbg started to flow with a final SICP = 6504 and
FFL @ 3400'. Flowed for 2 hours and recovered an additional 9 bbls of water and
tbg died. RU swab. IFL @ 7500'. Make 3 swab runs and tbg start to flow again
and recovered 12 bbls swabbing and 3 bbls flowing for 1 hour. RU swab. IFL @
10,000'. Make 1 run and rec 3 bbls of water and tbg flowed again for 1/2 hour and
RU swab. Make 1 additional run with IFL @ 10,000 while pulling from the "F"
Nipple @ 12215' tbg would not flow. SIFW. When tbg was flowing max psi was
25# on a full open 2" line. Final SICP = 500#. Recovered a total of 53 bbls of CO2
gas cut water with a very slight show of methane vapor.

24 Hour Forecast: Will POOH w/ tbg & prepare for additional zones.
LLTR: 193 bbis over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code cs:dbe Description of Operations

10/1/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB |1
Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316’ - 12324'

12292' - 12300

10/3/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( PERF |2 TIGHT HOLE!

Testing Wingate perfs 12292 - 12324'.

On 10/1/07 SITP = 1400# & SICP = 2000#. Bled down well to 0#. Pump 50 bbls of
2% KCL water to keep well dead. POOH w/ tbg. SIFN. On 10/2/07 wili set a CIBP
over the above perfs and perforate Entrada zones.

On 10/2/07 SICP = 250#. MIRU Cutters WL and wireline set a 5-1/2" CIBP @
12260’ to shut off Wingate perfs 12292' - 12324'. Perforate the following Entrada
intervals using a 3-3/8" csg gun and "Power Pak" charges at 3 JPF & 120" phasing
per the Dipole Sonic log dated 7/12/07: 11911' - 11913";, 11926’ - 11928"; 11948’ -
11952'; 11977' - 11979'; 11987 - 11989'; 11992' - 11994' & 12068' - 12070 (48
holes). IFL & FFL @ 6500'. ISICP = 250#, FSICP = 300#. RDMO Cutters WL.
Tagged CIBP prior to perforating. Bled off csg. RIH w/ 2-3/8" collar; 1 jt of tbg;
1.81" "F" Nipple and 364 jts of tbg to surface. Land tbg in hanger at 11889' and “F”
Nipple @ 11835'. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will start testing gross perforated Entradainterval 11911' -
12070

LLTR: 193 bbis over

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316" - 12324°

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068 - 12070

11992' - 11994

11987' - 11989

11977 - 11979

11948 - 11952'

11926' - 11928°

11941 - 11913

10/4/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE! 1t

Testing Wingate perfs 11913' - 12070".

On AM of 10/3/07 SITP = 450# and SICP = 400#. Bled off tbg with no fluid
recovery. RU swab. IFL @ 4800'. Make 19 swab runs and recovered 106 bbls of
water with no trace of methane but with light gas —probably leftover CO2. FFL @
9600' with a final SICP = 325# with no apparent fluid entry. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab the above Entrada perfs.

LLTR: 51 bbis
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

10/4/2007

10/5/2007

10/8/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

SWAB

SWAB

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324’

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbis over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068’ - 12070

11992' - 11994’

11987' - 11989’

11977'- 11979

11948' - 11952

11926’ - 11928'

11911'- 11913

Testing Entrada perfs 11813' - 12070".

On 10/4/07 SITP = 550# & SICP = 700#. Bled off tbg with no fluid recovery. RU
swab. IFL @ 9200". Make 2 swab runs and rec 11 bbis of water with a final SICP =
650# & FFL @ 5600". Tbg flowed for 1 hour and flowed back 3 bbls of water on a
full open 2" line and tbg died with a final SICP = 350#. RU swab. Tag "F" Nipple at
11835’ with no fluid evident and sand line parted when starting out of hole. POOH
wtih sand line and missing bottom 300' of line and tools. Bled off csg to 0#. POOH
with tbg and layed down parted sand line. RIH with tbg to 8800' and SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to RIH with tbg and land and return to swabbing.
LLTR: 37 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2"17#P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292' - 12300°

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992’ - 11994’

11987 - 11989

11977 - 11979

11948’ - 11952

11926' - 11928

11911'- 11913

Testing Entrada perfs 11913’ - 12070".
On 10/5/07 SITP = 400# and SICP = 375#. Bled off well with no fluid recovery.
Continue to RIH with tbg and land tbg tail in the hanger at 11869' and “F* Nipple at

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM




QuestarE & P Page 10 of 26
Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code gol:jbe Description of Operations
10/8/2007  |06:00- 16:00 | 10.00{ SWAB |1 11835'. RU swab. IFL @ "F" nipple @ 11835'. Make 2 runs and both runs were

dry with final SICP = 150#. Make 2 hourly runs to the "F" Nipple and both runs were
dry. RD swab & SIFW.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab test.
LLTR: 37 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300’

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994'

11987 - 11989"

11977 - 11979’

11948 - 11952

11926' - 11928'

11911'- 11913

10/9/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( SWAB (1 TIGHT HOLE!mmunnn

Testing Entrada perfs 11913’ - 12070".

On AM of 10/8/07 SITP = 2000# & SICP = 1800#. Bled off tbg with no fluid recovery
in 3 hours with final SICP = 225#. RU swab. RIH to "F" Nipple @ 11835’ with no
fluid level and no recovery. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Wil acidize the Entrada perfs.
LLTR: 37 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070'

11992' - 11994

11987' - 11989'

11977' - 11979

11948' - 11952'

11926' - 11928’
11911'-11913

10/10/2007 | 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE! 1

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:18 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code (.‘,S:dbe Description of Operations
10/10/2007  |06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 Testing Entrada perfs 11913’ - 12070".

On 10/9/07 SITP = 500#, SICP = 550#. Bled off well with no fluid recovery. Fill and
circ hole with 2% KCL water. MIRU Halliburton acid crew and acidize gross
perforated Entrada perfs 11913’ - 12070' down tbg as follows: Pump 10 bbls of 2%
KCL water and obtain break at 4915#. Open csg and circ 1000 gals of 15% HCL
with 75 - 7/8" Bio-balls to within 2000' of perfs and S| csg and pump the acid and
balls into the perfs with limited ball action {20-30#) breaks and flush with 71 bbls of
2% KCL water. Max rate = 5.9 BPM, avg rate = 4.7 BPM; max psi = 4915#1 ISIP =
1050#; (0.52). After 156 minutes SITP = 490#. RDMO Halliburton. Open thg after
20 minutes and tbg dead. RU swab. IFL @ surface. Make 21 swab runs and
recovered 113 bbls of water with acid gas and final pH of 6. FFL @ 2400°. Final
SICP = vacuum. With csg volume and acid and flush volume have 197 bbls LLTR.
RD swab. SIFN. On AM of 10/10/07 SITP = 400# & SICP = 700#.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab/flow the above perfs.
LLTR: 197 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316’ - 12324°

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbis over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068’ - 12070

11992' - 11994’

11987' - 11989

11977' - 11979’

11948’ - 11952'

11926' - 11928’

11911' - 11913'

10/11/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| SWAB |1 TIGHT HOLE!unmn

Testing Entrada perfs 11913' - 12070".

On AM of 10/10/07 SITP = 400# and SICP = 700#. Bled off tbg with no fluid
recovery. RU swab. IFL @ 3100". Make 4 swab runs wtih FFL at 1800' with SICP
= 600# and tbg started to flow after recovereing 40 bbls of water. Flow test the well
from 8:45 AM on 10/10/07 for the rest of the day and night and continue to flow test
on AM of 10/11/07 and @ 8:00 AM on 10/11/07 FTP = 100# on a 32/64" choke with
a SICP = 350# and currently dry gas for the last 4 hours and have recovered in the
last 25 hours a total of 181 bbls of water with an est LLTR of 16 bbis.

24 Hour Forecast: Wilt continue to flow test.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324’

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36-14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

10/11/2007

10/12/2007

10/19/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

PTST

OTH

12292' - 12300°
Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070
11992' - 11994
11987' - 11989
11977' - 11979'
11948' - 11952'
11926' - 11928’
11911' - 11913'

TIGHT HOLE!!
Testing Entrada perfs 11913' - 12070".

On AM of 10/11/07 FTP = 100# on a 32/64" choke with a SICP = 350# and flowing
dry gas. Continue to flow the well to the pit on a 32/64" choke for the last 24 hours
and at 7:00 AM on 10/12/07 FTP = 100# on a 32/64" choke with a SICP = 350# and
dry gas and to have recovered 1 bbl of water in the last 24 hours. Opened the tbg
several times during the last 24 hours on a full 2" line to unload and no fluid arrived.
Will continue to flow the well early this AM and then run BHP bombs for the next 7
days.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to flow test & then run BHP bombs for the next 7
days..

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292" - 12300°

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068’ - 12070

11992' - 11994’

11987 - 11989

11977 - 11979

11948’ - 11952'

11926' - 11928

11911 - 11913

Testing Entrada perfs 11913' - 12070".

On 10/12/07 FTP = 100# on a 32/64" choke with a SICP = 350# at 7:00 AM and
flowing dry gas to the pit. MIRU PLS wireline and soft set tandem BHP bombs in
the "F" Nipple at 11835’ with bombs in the "F" Nipple at 11835’ with bombs set at
11:00 AM. Continue to flow the tbg on a 32/64" choke for an additional 4 hours with
a final FTP = 100# and a final SICP = 325# with no fluid rec. and no water in the last
24 hours. Sl the well at 3:00 PM on 10/12/07 and well will remain Si until the bombs
are pulied AM of 10/19/07. Report discontinued until bombs are pulled.

24 Hour Forecast: Report discontinued until bombs are pulled.

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36-14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number. 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

10/19/2007

10/22/2007

10/23/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

OTH

BOP

PERF

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292' - 12300’

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068’ - 12070"

11992" - 11994

11987 - 11989

11977 - 11979

11948’ - 11952

11926' - 11928"

11911' - 11913

Testing Entrada perfs, 11913-12070°

On AM of 10/18/07 SITP and SICP=2400#. RIH with PLS and latch onto BHP
bombs in “F" nipple and POOH with bombs making gradient stops on the way out of
hole. Left well SIFW. On 10/22/07. will bleed well down and POOH with tbg.to
prepare to perforate additional intervals.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

LLTR: 15

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068’ - 12070

11992 - 11994

11987' - 11989

11977' - 11979

11948' - 11952'

11926' - 11928

11911 - 11913

Testing Entrada perfs, 11913-12070"
On AM of 10/22/07 SITP=2500# and SICP=2550#. Bled off well and pump 20 bbl.of
2% KCL water down tbg.to kill. POOH with tbg.and SIFN. On 10-23-07 will

perforate additional Entrada zones.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM




QuestarE & P

Operations Summary Report

Page 14 of 26

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

10/23/2007

10/24/2007

10/25/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

PERF

PERF

STIM

Load from yesterday: 15
Plus water today: 20
LLTR: 35

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324’

12292' - 12300'

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070'

11992' - 11994

11987' - 11989’

11977' - 11979’

11948 - 11952'

11926' - 11928
11911'-11913'

Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830-12070'

On AM of 10/23/07 SICP=1500#, MIRU Cutters WL and perforate the following
Entrada intervals at 3 JPF using a 3-3/8" ¢sg.gun and 120* phasing per the
Schlumberger Dipole Sonic log dated 7/12/07: 11830-11844' ( 42 holes). and
11851-11868' {51 holes). Final SICP =1500#. Hole was basically empty of fluids.
RDMO Cutters WL. Bled off csg..RIH with 1 jt of tbg; 1.81" "F" nipple and tbg.to
6800". SIFN. On 10/24/07 will continue to RIH with tbg.and acidize all Entrada

perfs. together.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Load from yesterday: 35
Plus water today: 50
LLTR: 85

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324’

12292' - 12300’

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994

11987' - 11989

11977 - 11979’

11948' - 11952'

11926' - 11928’
11911'-11913'

Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07): 11830-44'; 11851-68'

Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830' - 12070".

Printed:

12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code Cséjdbe Description of Operations

10/25/2007  {06:00 - 16:00 10.00| STIM 1 On AM of 10/24/07 SITP = 850# and SICP = 900#. Bled down tbg & pump 60 bbls
of water down the tbg. (Continue to RIH with tbg & land tbg tail @ 11803' & "F*
Nipple @ 11770". MIRU Halliburton Acid Crew & acidize gross perforated Entrada
perfs 11830 to 12070" as follows: Load hole and obtain break down the tbg at
643#. Pump 20 bbls of 2% KCL water with 50 - 7/8" Bio-balls and pump 1000 gals
of 15% HCL with 150 - 7/8" Bio-Balls and flush the tbg with 71 bbls of 2% KCL
water. Max rate = 4.8 BPM & avg rate = 4.4 BPM; max psi = 4070#, avg psi =
3236#; ISIP = 994#. 15 minutes = 647#. Had limited ball action. Total load to
recover inciuding past load and csg load and pump load is 525 bbls. RDMO
Halliburton. Open tbg to pit and flowed back 6 bbls of water and died. RU swab.
IFL @ surface. Make a total of 14 swab runs and recovered 82 bbls of water for a
total of 88 bbls recovered with a final pH = 8 and no gas and 0# final SICP. FFL @
3400'. RD swab and SIFN. On AM of 10/25/07 SITP & SICP = 0#.
24 Hour Forecast: Wiil continue to swab.
LLTR: 437 bbls
Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’
Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324’
12292 - 12300'
Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070'
11992' - 11994’
11987' - 11989
11977 - 11979'
11948’ - 11952
11926' - 11928
11911'- 11913
Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):
11830-44'; 11851-68'

10/26/2007 | 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| STIM 1 TIGHT HOLE!!uin

Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830 - 12070".

On 10/25/07 SITP & SICP = 0#. RU swab. IFL @ 3100". Make 23 swab runs and
recovered 120 bbls of water with med. gas on the last 9 runs and FFL @ 4900" w/
final SICP = 225#. Final pH = 8. RD swab and SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to swab.
LLTR: 307 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2*17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316’ - 12324

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From-To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

10/26/2007

10/29/2007

10/30/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

STIM

SWAB

SWAB

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068 - 12070"

11992' - 11994’

11987' - 11989’

11977 - 11979

11948’ - 11952'

11926' - 11928’

11911 - 11913

Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68'

Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830 - 12070".

On 10/26/07 SITP = 1200# and SICP = 1050#. Bled off tog. RU swab. IFL @
3300'. Make 18 runs and recovered 94 bbls of med gas cut water with a final pH = 8
and a final SICP = 925# with a FFL @ 3100". RD swab & SIFWE.

24 Hour Forecast:
LLTR: 213 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11984’

11987" - 11989

11977 - 11979

11948' - 11952

11926’ - 11928’

11911' - 11913'

Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68'

Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830' - 12070".

On 10/29/07 SITP = 1850# and SICP = 2000#. Bled off tbg with no fluid recovery.
RU swab. IFL @ 3700'. Make 3 runs and tbg started to flow after recovering 23
bbls of med gas cut water and FFL @ 2400’ and SICP = 1900#. Flowed the tbg for
6 hours on a full 2" line with a final FTP = 25# with a final FTP = 25# with a final
SICP = 650# and recovering 1 BPH the last 2 hours with a final pH = 7 and a total
recovery today between flowing and swabbing of 121 bbls. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will resume swabbing/flowing.

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:10 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Spud Date:
Rig Release:
Rig Number:

2/5/2007
5/10/2007
236

Date From - To | Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

10/30/2007  |06:00 - 16:00 10.00

10/31/2007  {06:00 - 16.00 10.00

SWAB

SWAB

LLTR: 92 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbis over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994

11987' - 11989'

11977' - 11979

11948' - 11952

11926' - 11928’

11911'- 11913’

Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68'

Testing Entrada gross perforated interval 11830' - 12070".

On 10-30-07 SITP=1800# and SICP=2000#. Bled off tbg.and flowed back 28 bbl.of
gas cut water with a final SICP=250# and flowed the tbg.for a total of 5 hours with
the last 4 hours dry gas and a final FTP=75# on a 32/64" choke. RU swab. IFL at
8700". Recovered 4 bbl.off water and tbg.flowed for 1 hour with 2 additional bbl.of
gas cut water with an initial SICP 550# and final SICP=400# with a FTP=50# on a
full 2" line. RIH again with swab with no fluid tag and no recovery of fluid. Sl the
well at 3:00PM with a final FTP=75# on a full 2" line wiht a final SICP=350#. Total
recovered today of 34 bbl..On 10/31/07 will check pressures and blow well down
and start to prepare for upcoming frac.

Load from yesterday: 92
Minus daily recovery: -34
LLTR: 58

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070’

11992' - 11994’

11987' - 11989’

11977 - 11979’

11948 - 11952’

11926 - 11928

11911'- 11913’

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26

Location:
Rig Name:

UNIT

Spud Date:  2/56/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

10/31/2007

11/1/2007

11/2/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

SWAB

OTH

TRP

Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):
11830-44'; 11851-68'

On 10/30/07 SITP & SICP = 1900#. Open the tbg to the pit for 8 hours and the final
FTP = 25# and the final SICP = 450# on a 32/64" choke and recovered 2 bbls of
water. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will pull tbg and prepare for frac work.

Load from yesterday: 58
Minus daily recovery: -2
LLTR: 56

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292 - 12300'

Finai Water = 193 bbis over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994’

11987' - 11989’

11977 - 11979

11948’ - 11952

11926' - 11928’

11911'- 11913

Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68'

On 11/1/07 SITP & SICP = 1950#. Bled off well and pump 20 bbis of 2% KCL water
down the tbg to kill well. POOH w/ tbg. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will start to move in equipment for fracs on 11/3/07.
LLTR: 76 bbts

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316 - 12324

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068’ - 12070'

11992' - 11994

11987' - 11989

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19

Spud Date:  2/5/2007

Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csolg; Description of Operations
11/2/2007  |06:00-16:00 | 10.00{TRP |5 11977' - 11979'
11948' - 11952'
11926' - 11928'
11911 - 11913
Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):
11830-44'; 11851-68'
11/5/2007  |06:00-16:00 | 10.00|STIM |3 TIGHT HOLEmmuy

On 11/2/07 SICP = 1500#. Open csg and bled off well to flow test. Flow tested for
3 hours on a 32/64" and had no fluid recovery with a final FCP = 100#. Sl the well.
MIRU Cutters WL & Stinger WH Services to prepare for frac work.
On 11/3/07 - MIRU Halliburton Frac Crew & left well Sl to prepare for work on
11/4/07.
On 11/4/07 - SICP = 1880#. Frac gross perforated Entrada interval 11830 - 12070
down 5-1/2" csg using a 35# Hybor2% KCL x-linked gel water system with 70% N2
as follows: Pump a 12200 gal pad and stage 1-4 20/40 mesh Ceramic sand in
27000 gals of fluid and stage a 4 ppg stage in 5700 gals of flud and flush with 11579
gals of fluid. Total of 90600# of sand and a total fluid load of 544 bbl. Total of 1671
MSCF N2. Max rate = 57.7 BPM; avg rate = 49.25 BPM; max psi = 5211#; avg psi
= 4729%; ISIP = 3075# (.69). Lubricate in a 5-1/2" comp frac plug and set at 11550".
Perforate per the Schlumberger Dipole Sonic log dated 7/12/07 the following
intervals at 3 JPF and 120" phasing using a 3-3/8" csg gun adn "Power Pak”
charges as follows: Dakota: 10888-80"; Cedar Mtn: 10918-28"; & 10946-50" (48
total holes). Frac the Dakota/Cedar Min gross interval 10888-10950' down csg
using the above system as follows: Pump a 12700 gal pad and stage 1-4 ppg 20/40
PRC sand in 27,000 gals of fluid and pump a 4 ppg stage in 5600 gals of fluid and
flush with 11170 gals of fluid. Total of 589 bbls and a total of 95000# of sand. Max
rate = 45 BPM; avg rate = 38.5 BPM; max psi = 6324#, avg psi = 5852#; ISIP =
5374# (.93). Lubricate in a comp frac plug & set @ 10800". Perforate Dakota Silt
interval: 10742-58' (48 holes) per the above log and gun. Frac Dakota Silt interval
10742-58' down csg using the above system as follows: Pump a 5000 gal pad and
stage 1-4 20/40 mesh PRC sand in 12000 gals of fluid and flush followed by a 4 ppg
stage in 4700 gals of fluid and flush with 11000 gals of fluid. Total of 37000# of
sand and a total of 370 bbls. Max rate = 43.3 BPM; avg rate = 35 BPM; max psi =
4200#; avg psi = 5635#; ISIP = 5097# (.91). Total LLTR = 1503 bbls. RDMO
Hallilburton & Cutters WL. Attempt to release Stinger Isolation Tool and had
hydraulic problems. Released tool at 4:15 AM on 11/5/07 and move out Stinger.
Open the csg at 4:30 AM on 11/5/07 with SICP = 4350#. At 7:00 AM on 11/5/07
FCP = 2125# on a 24/64" choke at a current rate est at 60 BPH of N2 water for an
est total of 210 bbls recovered. Continue to flow well to the pit to clean up.
NOTE: On the Dakota/Cedar Mtn frac used a total of 1568 MSCF and on the
Dakota Silt used 837 SCF N2.

24 Hour Forecast: Continue to flow well to the pit to clean up.
LLTR: 1369 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:
Zone #1: Wingate
12316'- 12324'

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36-14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
11/5/2007  |06:00-16:00 | 10.00|STIM |3 12292' - 12300'

Final Water = 193 bbls over

Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07

12068’ - 12070

11992' - 11994

11987' - 11989

11977 - 11979

11948’ - 11952

11926' - 11928

11811' - 11913

Additional Entrada perfs:

(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68'

Dakota:

10888-90°

Cedar Mtn:

10918-28";

10946-50'

Dakota Silt:

10742-58'

11/6/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| PTST 2 TIGHT HOLE!M 11y

At 7:00 AM on 11/5/07 FCP = 2125# on a 24/64" choke at an est rate of 60 BPH of
N2 water. Continue to flow the well for the next 23-1/2 hours and at 6:30 AM on
11/6/07 FCP = 1400# on a 24/64" choke with an est huorly rate of 20 BPH with med
methane gas and an est recovery in the last 23-1/2 hours of 605 bbls.

24 Hour Forecast: Will continue to flow the well to the pit to clean up well.
LLTR: 734 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324'

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/Q7
12068’ - 12070

11992' - 11994

11987' - 11989’

11977' - 11979’

11948' - 11952'

11926 - 11928

11911 - 11913

Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):

1183044'; 11851-68'
Dakota:

10888-90'

Cedar Mtn:

10918-28';

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36-14-S 19-E 26

Location:
Rig Name:

UNIT

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number:. 236

Date

From-To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

11/6/2007

11/7/2007

11/8/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16.00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

PTST

PTST

LOG

10946-50"
Dakota Silt:
10742-58'

On 11/6/07 through AM of 11/7/07 continue to flow the well to the pit to clean up. At
7:00 AM on 11/7/07 FCP = 1600# on a 18/64" choke at an est rate of 5 BPH of high
gas cut gas. Have recovered 40 bbls of water in the last 7 hours. Will S the well at
7:00 AM to prepare to lubricate in a CBP this AM. Have recovered a total of 1110
est bbls with 469 bbis LLR.

24 Hour Forecast: RIH w/ bit & tbg to drill out plugs.
LLTR: 734 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070'

11892' - 11994’

11987' - 11989'

11977 - 11979

11948' - 11952'

11926' - 11928

11911'- 11913’
Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):

11830-44"; 11851-68'
Dakota:

10888-90

Cedar Mtn:

10918-28";

10946-50"

Dakota Silt:

10742-58'

At 7:00 AM on 11/7/07 FCP = 1600# on a 18/64" choke with an est rate of high gas
cut water. S| the well & MIRU Cutters WL. Lubricate in a 5-1/2" CBP and set @
10516". Bied off well and RDMO Cutters WL. RIH w/ 4-3/4" mill and pump off bit
sub assembly & tbg to 1790". Blew hydraulic hose on pump. Had to go to town to
obtain new one. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Continue to RIH & drill out composite plugs with foam unit.
LLTR: 469 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations

11/8/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| LOG 4

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over

Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07

12068' - 12070'

11992' - 11994'

11987' - 11989'

11977' - 11979’

11948' - 11952

11926' - 11928'

11911'- 11913

Additional Entrada perfs:

(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68'

Dakota:

10888-90"

Cedar Mtn:

10918-28";

10946-50'

Dakota Silt:

10742-58"

11/9/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| PTST |2 TIGHT HOLE!!!! m

On 11/8/07 SICP & SITP = 0# at 10516'. Continue in hole with mill and tbg and tag

CBP @ 10516' and pump 60 bbls of water and drill out CBP and well uploaded hole.
Continue to pump water at a rate of 1-1/2 BPM with well unloading the water on

various chokes with FCP of 850# to 1400#. Continue to flow well overnight while

flowing N2 gas with no methane and est 5 bbls of water per hour on various chokes

with FCP of 1200# on a 28/64" choke for an est recovery of 70 bbls in the past

13-1/2 hours and still N2. After drilling out CBP also had considerable sand flows.

24 Hour Forecast: Will attempt to continue to clean out well.
LLTR: 399 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324’

12292' - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994'

11987' - 11989"

11977 - 11979

11948 - 11952'

11926' - 11928'

11911"- 11913

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM




QuestarE & P Page 23 of 26
Operations Summary Report
Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Location:  36-14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236
Date From - To | Hours | Code (_-;Sol:jbe Description of Operations

11/8/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00|PTST |2 Additional Entrada perfs:

(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68'

Dakota:

10888-90'

Cedar Mtn:

10918-28";

10946-50'

Dakota Silt:

10742-58'
11/12/2007 |06:00- 16:00 |  10.00| PTST |2 TIGHT HOLEm

On AM of 11/9/07 continue to ciean up well overnight to the pit with a FCP=1200#
on a 28/64" choke and an est. Recovery of 5 bbl. of N2 gas cut water per hour.
Open csg.on a 40/64" choke to get psi down to 900#. RIH with 21 jts.of tbg.and tag
comp.frac plug at 11500". Attempt to drill out comp. frac piug and pulling over
10-20M and not getting torque to bit. Work tbg.and attempt to dril! up plug for 4-1/2
hours. No success. Pull mill to 10885' and still seeing drag with back torgue after
rotating. Left well flowing to the pit overnight to continue to clean up N2. At 7:00AM
on 11/10/07 FCP=750# on a 40/64" choke at an est.rate of 5 bbl.per hour and an
est.recovery in the last 14 hours of 70 bbl.. Will continue to attempt to clean out weli
today (11/10/07).

On 11/10/07 FCP=750# on a 40/64" choke and SITP=0# with float in string. PU 19
jts of tbg.and RIH and drill out comp.frac plug at 11500" with foam unit and power
swivel. Continue in the hole andtag sand fill at 12161". Attempt to clean out sand
and pressure up on tbg..Have 91' of rathole. Lay down 2 jts.of tbg.with drag still
visible and pump 10 bbl.of water down the tbg.and drop ball to shear off bit sub.
Follow ball with 85 bbl.of water and did not see bit sub shear off. Lay down 43 jts.of
tbg.to put tbg. tail at 10690'. Csg flowing N2 and foam on a 40/64" choke with 600#
FCP. Sl both sets of pipe rams. Will continue to clean up well over the weekend
and land tbg.on 11/12/07 at 3:00Pm on 11/11/07 FCP=850# on a 32/64" choke with
an est.rate of 5 bbl.per hour and 130 bbl.total recovery in the last 25 hours and no
methane gas. At 6:30AM on 11/12/07 FC=900# on a 24/64" choke at an est.rate of
5 bbl.per hour and heavy methane gas since midnight and an est.total recovery of
175 bbl.since 1:00PM on 11/10/07. On 11/12/07 will land the tbg. and ND BOP's
and NUWH and take gas analysis. All water pumped on 11/10/97 to shear off bit
sub was recovered in the 1st hour as well unloaded the csg..

Load from yesterday: 399
Minus daily recovery: 175
LLTR: 224

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468’

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316' - 12324

12292 - 12300

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068 - 12070

11992" - 11894

11987 - 11989’

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM




QuestarE & P Page 24 of 26
Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Spud Date:  2/6/2007
Location:  36- 14-S 19-E 26 Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 236

Date | From - To | Hours | Code Csz;jdbe Description of Operations
11/12/2007 |06:00-16:00 |  10.00| PTST |2 11977 - 11979"

11948' - 11952

11926' - 11928"

11911' - 11913'

Additional Entrada perfs:

(10/23/07):

1183044, 11851-68'

Stage #3 Dakota:

10888-90'

Cedar Mtn:

10918-28';

10946-50"

Stage #4 Dakota Silt:

10742-58"

11/13/2007 |06:00 - 16:00 10.00| CIRC 1 TIGHT HOLE!tttinniun

On 11/12/07 SITP & SICP = 1550#. Pump 30 bbls of 2% KCL water down the tbg.
Attempt to land tbg hanger and damaged the seals due to debris in the tbg head.
Replace seals in hanger after pumping out across the tbg head with foam and water
and blowing out ice and composite material. Successfully land tbg hanger with tbg
tail @ 10700' & "F* Nipple @ 10665'. ND BOP's and NU WH. Clean up well to the
pit. Took gas sample readings as follows: N2 =2.012%; CO2 = .826%; Methane =
92.88%; BTU = 1021.16;

Grav = 0.610.; Open well to the pit to continue to clean up overnight with no
readings this AM.

24 Hour Forecast: Will RDMO Basin Well Service & turn well over the production
department. Tbg deatil report to follow AM.

LLTR: 224 bbis

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 174 P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate

12316’ - 12324

12292' - 12300'

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068’ - 12070

11992' - 11994"

11987" - 11989

11977 - 11879

11948’ - 11952'

11926' - 11928’

11911'- 11913

Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68'
Stage #3 Dakota:

10888-90"

Cedar Mtn:

10918-28";

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Sub
Code Code

Description of Operations

11/13/2007

11/14/2007

11/15/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

CIRC 1

OTH

OTH

10946-50"
Stage #4 Dakota Silt:
10742-58'

On 11/13/07 - Too windy to rig down Basin Well Service. Wil attempt again on
11/14/07.

Tbg Detail: 1 jt; 1.81" “F" Nipple & 328 jts of tbg to surface. All tbg is new 2-3/8"
EUE 8rd P-110. Tbg Tail at 10700' & "F" Nipple at 10665' KB depth: KB = 22'.
Tbg is landed in the tbg hanger with a hanger. WH is 7-1/16x10k. Sand fill with
pump off bit sub assembly at 12161'. Bottom perf @ 12070".

Well will be producing from the Entrada, Dakota/Silt & Cedar Mtn intervals.
24 Hour Forecast: Will RDMO Basin Well Service.
LLTR: 224 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316' - 12324

12292' - 12300'

Final Water = 193 bbis over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070

11992' - 11994

11987 - 11989

11977 - 11979

11948' - 11952

11926' - 11928'

11911'- 11913
Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68'
Stage #3 Dakota:
10888-90

Cedar Mtn:

10918-28';

10946-50'

Stage #4 Dakota Silt:
10742-58'

On 11/14/07 RDMO Basin Well Service. Turn well to production. Final report of
completion.

Tbg Detail: 1 jt; 1.81" "F" Nipple & 328 jts of tbg to surface. All tbg is new 2-3/8"
EUE 8rd P-110. Tbg Tail at 10700" & "F” Nipple at 10665' KB depth: KB = 22'.

Tbg is landed in the tbg hanger with a hanger. WH is 7-1/16x10k. Sand fill with
pump off bit sub assembly at 12161'. Bottom perf @ 12070".

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19
36- 14-S 19-E 26
Rig Name: UNIT

Location:

Spud Date:  2/5/2007
Rig Release: 5/10/2007
Rig Number: 236

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

11/15/2007

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

OTH

Well will be producing from the Entrada, Dakota/Silt & Cedar Mtn intervals.
LLTR: 224 bbls

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 17# P-110
Csg Depth: 12468'

Perfs:

Zone #1: Wingate
12316 - 12324’

12292 - 12300°

Final Water = 193 bbls over
Zone #2 Entrada on 10/2/07
12068' - 12070'

11992' - 11994’

11987' - 11989'

11977 - 11979'

11948' - 11952

11926" - 11928

11911' - 11913
Additional Entrada perfs:
(10/23/07):

11830-44'; 11851-68'
Stage #3 Dakota:
10888-90

Cedar Mtn:

10918-28";

10946-50

Stage #4 Dakota Silt:
10742-58'

Printed: 12/3/2007 9:53:19 AM




NOTICE

Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> Awellis considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testing as required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:
» Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log
* A copy of electric and radioactivity logs, if run
» A copy of drillstem test reports,
* A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation
determinations
A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled
A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for
each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timely manner will result in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator; Questar Exploration & Production Co Today’s Date: 02/14/2008

Well: APl Number: Drilling Commenced:

43 oA RID
FR I 2L~ 4-19
14> 208 3z

See Attachment

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance File



Well:

WV 5W-36-7-21

WV 4D-12-8-12

WVX 11D-22-8-21

WV 3DML-13-8-21

FR 7P-36-14-19

SU 8M-12-7-21

WV 12AD-8-8-22R
WRU EIH 7AD-35-8-22
RWS 14D-6-9-24

RW 34-27ADR

NBZ 8D-31-8-24

WRU EIH 6D-5-8-23
WRU EIH 9CD-26-8-22

drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wcr
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer
drlg rpts/wer

API Number:

4304734099
4304734268
4304734902
4304737923
4304738992
4304736096
4304739321
4304738641
4304737414
4304739445
4304737238
4304738994
4304738649

Commenced:
05/29/2003
09/26/2003
03/15/2005
09/27/2006
02/05/2007
03/18/2007
05/10/2007
06/08/2007
07/20/2007
08/07/2007
08/27/2007
09/04/2007
10/03/2007



o

Form 31604 Form approved.
(November 1933) UNITED STATES SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE Budget Bureau No, 1004-0137
(Qm‘eﬂy 9-330) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR (See °th¢r in- Expires August 31, 1985
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT structions on
C P@ AJ F g D T reverse sids). | 5. LEASEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
Ui BAR ML-49279
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTER OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG * UTE TRIBE
la. TYPE OF WELL oL GAS 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
WELL D WELL D DRY D Other N/A
b TYPE OF COMPLETION
' NEW WORK DEEP- PLUG DIFF. 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
WELL OVER EN [_—_'] BACK D RESVR l:] Other N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 9. WELLNO.
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. FR7P3614 19
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. Contact: Dahn Caldwell 435-781-4342 10.  FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH - VERNAL, UT 84078 Fax # 435.781.4357
4.  LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements)* UNDESIGNATED
_ Per DKD
Atsarface  1910° FSL, 162’ FWL, NWSW, LOT 3, SEC 31-T14S-R20E T \I\EW H. SEC.T,R.,M.,OR BLOCK AND SURVEY
< OR AREA
At top rod. interval reported below SEC 31-T14S-R20E - SURFACE
At total depth 1 . SEC 36-T14S-RI9E - BOTTOM
14.  PERMITNO. ATE ISSUED 12 COUNTYOR 13.  STA
[R55 il |19 e\ D CouNT TATE
> r 2. 43-047-38992 UINTAH uT
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (Ready to prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GR, ETC.)* | 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD
2/3/07 5/7/07 11/14/07 KB
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG BACK TD., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23, INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
040 "\) Bf HOW MANY* DRILLED BY
12,485° 12,161’ (as of 11/10/07) ——e> Yes No
24, PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION--TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADE
See Attachment Page 1
Yes
26. TYPEELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELY, CORED
CBL ﬁ Dipole Sonic No
28, CASING RECORD (Report all sirings saf in wel)
CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LBFT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED
13-3/8” 48# 502° 17-1/2» 665 sxs
9-5/8” 474 4,267’ 12-1/4” 1,069 sxs
5-1/2” 17# 12,468° 7-5/8” 1,380 sxs
2. LINER RECORD 30, TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)
2-3/8” 10,700°
31. PERFORATION RECORD (Trterval, size and number) 32, ACID, SHOT, FRA CEMENT ETC.
See Attachment Page 1 O"l - e DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED
\ O—I 4 g‘ ‘2 O 0 P n See Attachment nge 1 See Attachment Page 1
1200 « 1324 - Uosed
33.¢ PRODUCTION )
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gas lift, pumping—size and type of pump) WELL STATUS (Producing or
shut-in)
11/14/07 Flowi Producing
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N FOR OIL-BBL. GAS--MCF. WATER-BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD
11/19/07 24 13 > ] 7 | 2305 | 3
FLOW. TUBINGPRESS. [ CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL-BEY.. GAS-MCF WATER—BBL OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR )
24-HOUR RATE
1,607 1,736 > I I
34, DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, used for fuel, vented, ¢tc.) TEST WITNESSED BY
Sold
35. LISTOF ATTACHMENTS
‘Wellbore Schematic & Perforation Detail Attachment Page 1
36. 1hereby certify that the foregoing and ed jon is complete and as from all available records
SIGNED JIM SIMONTON f# COMPLETION SUPERVISOR DATE 2/17/68

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person kn
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or represen

(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)

»

DIV. OF OIL. GAS 2 rIMINA

APR 01 2008

% M%@to make to any dep:

matter within its jurisdiction




37. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES: (Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof; cored intervals; and all
drill-stem tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures, and

38. GEOLOGIC MARKERS
recoveries): FR7P361419
FORMATION TOP BOTTOM DESCRIPTION, CONTENTS, ETC. TOP
GREEN RIVER SURFACE NAME MEAS. DEPTH TRUE
WASATCH 2410° VERT. DEPTH
MESA VERDE 4365 GREEN RIVER SURFACE
CASTLE GATE 6,235° WASATCH 2,410°
MANCOS 6,925° MESA VERDE 4,365’
DAKOTA SILT 10,265° CASTLE GATE 6,235°
DAKOTA 10,360° MANCOS 6,925’
CEDAR MOUNTAIN 10,440° DAXKOTA SILT 10,265
MORRISON 10,650° DAKOTA 10,360°
CURTIS 11,205° CEDAR MOUNTAIN 10,440°
ENTRADA 11,285° MORRISON 10,650’
CARMEL 11,610° CURTIS 11,205°
WINGATE 11,820° ENTRADA 11,285°
D 12,485° CARMEL 11,610°
WINGATE 11,820
D 12,485°
»

s



o®

FR 7P 36 14 19 — ATTACHMENT PAGE 1

PERFORATION DETAIL.

oo bt — T
10742 — 10758’ 37,000  Lbs in 15,540 ' Gals | Open - Dakota Silt
10888'-10890° ] o . Open-Dakota
10918’ -10928" 95,000 ; Lbsin 24738 ' Gals  Open—CedarMtn
10946’ — 10950° : | Open—CedarMtn
1830108 \Y _ Open-Entrada
11851'—11868" |} 1 Open - Entrada
11911 -11913 1| ,_ . Open-Entrada
11926'-11928 |\ Fracw/ 90,600 | Lbsin 22,848 Gals _Open-Entrada |
11948'-11952') || Fracw/ 1671 | MSCF N2 Open-Entrada
11977'-11979°| 3| Acidizedw/ 1000  Galsof | 15%HCL | Open - Entrada
111987'-11989" » | ACldIZEd W/ 1000 | Galsof | 15% HCL @ __v___'_Open Entrada 5
11992’ -11994°1 |} 000 . s ' Open-Entrada |
12068 - 12070 J - - o - Open - Entrada ]
SetacCrBp@ . @ Set a CIBP @ 12260’
12260 ]
12292'-12300') y  Fracw/| 43,000 | Lbsin 18,480 GaIsCIosed -Wingate
12316'-12324 & | Acidizedw/ 1000 | Galsof = 15%HCL  Closed - Wingate

Stage 1 - Perf Wingate 12316-24' & 12292-12300". Broke down perfs

12292' - 12324' w/ 1000 gals of 15% HCL. Acid

Frac 12292' - 12324' w/ 43,000# sand.

Set 5-1/2" CIBP @ 12260' to shut off Wingate perfs.

Stage 2 - Perf Entrada 12068-70', 11992-94', 11987-89', 11977-79',

11948-52, 11926-28' & 11911-13". i

Acidize 11911' - 12070"' w/ 1000 gals of 15% HCL Acid

Stage 2 Cont. - Perf Entrada 11851-68', 11830-44".

Acidize 11830" - 12070' w/ 1000 gals of 15% HCL Acid

Frac 11830' - 12070' w/ 90,600# sand & 1,671 MSCF N2.

Stage 3 - Perf Cedar Mtn 10946- 50' & 10918-28' & Dakota 10888-90'

Frac Cedar Mtn/Dakota w/ 95,000# sand.

Stage 4 - Perf Dakota Silt 10742-58'. Frac w/ 37,000# sand.




CONFIDENTIAL
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Deviation Summary
Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Location: 36-14-S 19-E 26 SIT# V.S. AZI (%)
TMD: 12,074.0 (ft) TVD: 11,620.44 (ft) Spud Date: 2/5/2007 OH 260.00
Closure Distance: 2,499.6 (ft) Closure Direction: 307.57 (°) Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature o 0.00
SIT# T™D Angle Azimuth CT™ TVD N/-S E/W Vert. Section DLS BUR Type
L)) ) ) () () ) ) (°1100f) (°/100f)

OH 0.0 0.00 0.00| NYN 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
OH 655.0 0.60 293.98| YNN 654.99 1.39 -3.13 3.33 0.09 0.08 MsS
OH 1,129.0 0.80 318.18| YNN 1,128.95 4.87 -7.61 8.34 0.07 0.04 MSS
OH 1,570.0 0.80 323.38| YNN 1,569.91 9.63 -11.50 13.00 0.02 0.00 MSS
OH 2,054.0 1.40 350.38| YNN 2,053.82 18.18 -14.50 17.44 0.16 0.12 mss
OH 24120 1.46 330.27| YNN 2411.71 26.75 -16.85 21.24 0.08 002 MWD
OH 2,470.0 1.58 352 YNN 2,469.69 28.24 -17.06 21.70 1.12 0.21 MWD
OH 25320 1.63 308.06| YNN 2,531.67 2074 -17.83 272 268 056 MWD
OH 2,500.0 281 326.18] YNN 2,580.62 31.52 -19.39 24557 1.97 152  MwD
OH 2,653.0 3.81 303.81) YNN 2,652.51 33.97 -21.99 27.55 256 159 MWD
OH 27170 497 296.95/ YNN 2716.33 36.41 26.22 3215 1.99 1.81 MWD
OH 2,781.0 6.11 204.43| YNN 2,780.03 39.08 -31.80 38.10 1.82 178 MWD
OH 2,847.0 7.75 28831 YNN 2,845.54 4193 -30.22 4591 272 248 MWD
OH 2,964.0 11.00 286.88| YNN 2,960,896 47.65 -57.40 64.80 278 2.78 MWD
OH 3,028.0 12.31 283.43| YNN 3,023.64 51.01 -69.88 77.67 232 205 MWD
OH 3,001.0 1357 281.31] YNN 3,085.04 54.01 -83.66 91.76 214 200 MWD
OH 3,154.0 14.94 27881 YNN 3,146.10 56.71 -98.93 107.27 2.38 247 MWD
OH 32180 16.28 27828/ YNN 3,207.74 .59.26 -115.96 124.49 211 209 MWD
OH 3,2820 17.48 280.01| YNN 3,268.98 62.23 -134.30 143.07 203 1.88) MWD
OH 3,377.0 16.75 279.93| YNN 3,350.77 67.07 -161.84 171.03 0.77 077 MWD
OH 34720 16.00 281.18] YNN 3,450.92 71.97 18847 197.81 0.87 079 MWD
OH 3,567.0 16.06 28393 YNN 3,542.23 77.67 21377 224,01 0.80 008/ MWD
OH 3,661.0 16.25 28256/ YNN 363252 83.66 -230.22 250.12 0.45 020, MWD
OH 3,755.0 15.56 279.31] YNN 372292 88.56/ . -264.50 275.86 1.20 073 MWD
OH 3,850.0 16.13 279.31| YNN 3,814.31 9275 -290.10 301.80 0.60 060/ MWD
OH 3,944.0 16.05 280.56] YNN 3,904.63 97.25 31576 327.85 0.38 009 MWD
OH 4,0380 16.76 281.24| YNN 3,994.80 102.27 -341.83 354,39 0.78 076| MWD
" OH 4,133.0 15.50 284.18| YNN 4,086.06 108.05 -367.57 380.75 1.58 -1.33) MWD
OH 4,245.0| - 15.23 288.54{ YNN 4,194.06 116.40 -396.03 410.22 1.08) 024 MWD
OH 43100 15.38 289.56| YNN 4,256.76 122,00 -412.24 42717 0.47 023 MWD
OH 43770 16.00 292.06| YNN 4,321.26 128.44 42017 444,96 1.37 093 MWD
OH 4,439.0 17.38 204.18| YNN 4,380.65 135.44 -445.54 462.29 243 223 MWD
OH 4,501.0 18.94 207.06| YNN 4,430.56 143.81 46295 480.89 2.90 252 . MWD

Printed: 3/17/2008 8:23:39 PM
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Deviation Summary
Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Location: 36- 14-S 19-E 26 SIT# V.S. AZI (%)
TMD: 12,074.0 (ft) TVD: 11,629.44 (it) Spud Date: 2/5/2007 OH 280.00
Closure Distance: 2,499.6 (ft) Closure Direction: 307.57 (°) Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature o1 0.00
SIT# T™D Angle Azimuth CT™ TVD N/-S El-W Vert. Seotion DLS BUR Type
(1) ) ©) {ft) () {ft) (ft) {°1100t) (°/100ft) _

OH 4563.0 19.38 300.18] YNN 4,498.12 153.56 -480.81 500.17 1.80 0.7 MWD
OH 4,657.0 20.38 303.18| YNN 4558652 170.36 -507.99 529.85 1.52 1.08 MWD
OH 47200 21.88 305.68| YNN 4,645.29 183.21 -526.71 550.52 2.78 2.38 MWD
OH 47820 22,81 307.68| YNN 4,702.63 197.30 -545.60 571.57 1.94 1.60 MWD
OH 48440 23.00 308.43| YNN 4,750.74 21217 -564.60 592,87 0.56 0.31 MWD
OH 4,907.0 22.38 308.56| YNN 4,817.87 227.30 -583.62 614.23 0.89 -0.98 MWD
OH 49520 21.56 308.81| YNN 4,859.60 237.82 -598.76 629.00 1.83 -1.82 MWD
OH 5,001.0 21.63 300.31| YNN 4,905.16 249.18 -610.77 644.76 0.40 0.14 MWD
OH 5,083.0 21.50 308.06/ YNN 4,962.82 263.11 -628.79 664.93 1.94 0.21 MWD
OH 5,125.0 21.56 301.43| YNN 5,020.50 " 275.74 -847.70 685.74 274 0.10 MWD
OH 5,186.0 21.75 300.18| YNN 5,077.20 287.27 -667.03 706.78 0.82 0.31 MWD
OH 5,250.0 21.88 301.08| YNN 5,136.61 299.38 -687.50 720.04 0.55 0.20 MWD
OH 5,301.0 21.81 303.56| YNN 5,183.95 309.52 -703.54 748.60 1.83 0.14 MWD
OH 5,374.0 2313 303.31| YNN 5,251.41 324,89 -726.82 77219 1.81 1.81 MWD
OH 5,436.0 23.81 304.8t1| YNN 5,308.28 338.72 -747.27 794,74 1.46 1.10 MWD
OH 5,498.0 25.44 306.56| YNN 5,364.64 353.80 -768.25 818.01 288 2.63 MWD
OH 5,560.0 25.13 307.93] YNN 5,420.70 360.83 -789.33 841.55 1.07 -0.50 MWD
OH 5,685.0 25.25 300.81| YNN 5,533.81 403.21 -830.74 888.14 0.65 0.10 MWD
OH 5,748.0 25.31 31043 YNN 5,590.78 420,55 -851.31 911.41 0.43 0.10 MWD
OH 58100 24.19 311.43) YNN 5,647.08 43755 -870.93 933.68 1.93 -1.81 MWD
OH 5,873.0 24.49 311.93| YNN 5,704.49 454,81 -890.32 955.77 0.58 0.48 MWD
OH 5,935.0 25.00 312.06{ YNN 5,760.79 47218 -909.61 977.78 0.83 0.82 MWD
OH 5,996.0 24,81 31358{ YNN 5,816.12 489.63 -928.45 899,37 1.08 0.31 MWD
OH 6,059.0 24,63 314.43| YNN 5,873.35 507.93 -947.40 1,021.21 0.64 -0.29 MWD
OH 6,121.0 24.79 315.00, YNN 5,920.67 526.17 -965.82 1,042.52 0.46 0.26 MWD
OH 6,184.0 23.94 317.18| YNN 5,987.06 544,88 -083.85 1,063.52 1.96 -1.35 MWD
OH 6,247.0 22.50 319.08| YNN 6,044.96 563.36 -1,000.44 1,083.07 2.57 229 MWD
OH 6,300.0 21.60 318.14| YNN 6,102.42 580.83 -1,015.83 1,101.25 155 -1.45 MWD
OH 8,371.0 - 22,61 317.22) YNN 6,150.86 598,07 -1,031.54 1,118.72 172 1.63 MWD
OH 6,433.0 24.06 31468 YNN 6,216.79 615.71] -1,048.62 1,139.61 2.85 2.34 MWD
OH 6,495.0 26.59 31559 YNN 6,272.83 634,51 -1,067.32 1,161.29 413 4.08 MWD
OH 6,588.0 26.34 314.85| YNN 6,356.08 663.93 -1,006.51 1,195.14 0.44 -0.27 MWD
OH 8,681.0 25.88 313:68/ YNN 6,439.59 - 89250 -1,125.82 1,228.96 0.74| .. 0.49 MWD

Printed: 3/47/2008 3:23:39 PM
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Deviation Summary
Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Location: 36- 14-S 19-E 26 ST# V.8, AZI (%)
TMD: 12,074.0 (ft) TVD: 11,629.44 (ft) Spud Date: 2/5/2007 OH 280.00
Closure Distance: 2,499.6 (ff) Closure Direction: 307.57 (°) Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature 01 0.00
SIT # T™D Angle’ Azimuth CT™ TVD NS EMW Vert, Section DLS BUR Type
{ft) ) ) {ft) (ft) ") (ft) {°/100ft) ("r100ft)
OH 8,777.0 24.81 31256 YNN 6,526.35 720.59 -1,155.81 1,263.38 1.22 1.1 MWD
OH 6,869.0 24.45 313.00( YNN 6,609.98 746.63 -1,183.95 1,205.61 0.44 039 MWD
OH 6,964.0 24.88 312.31| YNN 6,696.31 773.49 -1,213.41 1,328.99 0.54 0.45 MWD
OH 7,057.0 24.05 311.14| YNN 6,780.96 799.13 -1,241.85 1,361.75 1.03 0.89 MWD
OH 7,151.0 23.25 300.68] YNN 6,867.07 82358 -1,270.55 1,394.26 1.05 0.85 MWD
OH 7,244.0 21.18 311.75] YNN 6,953.16 846.49 -1,297.21 1,424.50 2.38 223 MWD
OH 7,338.0 22,19 31268 YNN 7,040.51 869.83 -1,322.93 1,453.88 1.13 1.07 MWD
OH 7,431.0 23.23 31383 YNN 7,126.30 8984.44 -1,349.08 1,483.90 1.22 112 MWD
OH 7,524.0 275 313.43| YNN 7,211.91 919.50 -1,375.37 1,514.14 0.54 0,52 MWD
OH 7,618.0 19.81 313.08| YNN 7,299.49 942,88 -1,400.21 1,542.66 313 313 MWD
OH 7.711.0 19.09 31653 YNN 7,387.19 964.67 -1,422.19 1,568,09 1.46 0.77 MWD
OH 7,804.0 18.78 316.47| YNN 7,475.15 986.56 -1,442.96 159235 0.33 033 MWD
OH 7,866.0 19.44 313.81| YNN 7,533.74 1,000.94 -1,457.28 1,608.95 1.76 1.06 MWD
OH 7,928.0 20.38 313.31| YNN 7,592.03 1,015.49 -1,472.58 1,626.55 154 1.52 MWD
OH 7,990.0 20.01 31311 YNN 7,650.22 1,030.14 -1,488.18 1,644.45 0.61 -0.60 MWD
OH 8,052.0 2031, 312.06] YNN 7,708.42 1,044.60 -1,503.91 1,662.46 0.76 0.48 MWD
OH 8,114.0 20.44 312.43| YNN 7,766.54 1,059.11 -1,519.89 1,680.71 0.30 0.21 MWD
OH 8,176.0 21.44 312.68| YNN 7,824.45 1,074.10 -1,536.21 1,699.39 1.62 1.61 MWD
OH 8,238.0 20.75 310.81] YNN 7,882.29 1,088.98 -1,552.86 1,718.36 1.55 4.1 MWD
OH 8,300.0 19.13 310.06| YNN 7,940.57 1,102.68 -1,568.95 1,736.59 2.65 -2.61 MWD
OH 8,363.0 18.19 300.81| YNN 8,000.26 1,115.62 -1,584.40 1,754.06 150 -1.49 MWD
OH 8,425.0 18.13 311.06| YNN 8,059.17 1,128.15 -1,599.11 1,770.72 0.64 -0.10 MWD
OH 8,488.0 18.91 31219 YNN 8,118.91 1,141.44 -1,614.06 1,787.75 1.36 1.24 MWD
OH 8,550.0 19.56 313.56] YNN 8,177.45 1,155.34 -1,629.03 1,804.90 1.28 1.05 MWD
OH 8,615.0 20.25 31231 YNN 8,238.57 1,170.41 -1,645.23 1,823.48 1.25 1.06 MWD
OH 8,709.0 21.63 312.93| ' YNN 8,326.36 1,193.17 -1,669.95 1,851.77 1.49 1.47 MWD
OH 8,820.0 20.44 31318/ YNN 8,420.96 1,220.36 -1,699.06 1,885.16 1.08 -1.07 MWD
OH 8,863.0 19.81 31400/ YNN 8,470.33 1,230.56 -1,700.78 1,897.49 1.61 .47 MWD
OH 8,855.0 20.50 316.18| YNN 8,556.70 1,253.02 1,732.15 1,023.42 1.1 0.75 MWD
OH 9,079.0 19.44 31518 YNN 8,673.24| - 1,283.32 -1,761.73 1,057.8 0.90 0.85 MWD
OH 9,173.0 17.88 31468) YNN 8,762.30 1,304.56 -1,783.02 1,982.46 1.67 -1.66 MWD
OH 9,265.0 16.94 314.93| YNN 8,850.08 1,323.96 -1,802.55 2,005.07 1.02 -1.02 MWD
OH 9,359.0 15.55| 31571| YNN 8,940.33 1,342.65 -1,821.04 2,026.52 1.50 -1.48 MWD

Printed: 3/17/2008 3:23:39 PM
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Deviation Summary
\Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 _ Location: 36- 14-S 19-E 26 S/T# V.8.AZI (%)
TMD: 12,074.0 (ft) TVD: 11,629.44 (ft) Spud Date: 2/5/2007 OH 280.00
Closure Distance: 2,499.6 (ft) Closure Direction: 307.57 (°) Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature o1 0.00
SIT# T™D Angle Azimuth CTM TVD N/-S EIW Vert. Section DLS BUR Type
(") ") ) () ) (%) () (°/1001) (*/100ft)

OH 9,453.0 15.81 31543 YNN 9,030.83 1,360.79 -1,838.83 2,047.19 0.20 0.28 MWD
OH 9,545.0 15.44 313.81| YNN 9,119.43 1,378.20 -1,856.46 2,057.58 0.62 -0.40 MWD
OH 9,638.0 13.97 312.80| YNN 9,200.38 1,394.40 -1,873.63 2,087.30 1.60 -1.58 MWD
OH 98,731.0 13.94 31556 YNN 9,209.64 1,410.02 -1,889.71 2,105.85 0.72 .03 MWD
OH 9,825.0 13.06 315.08] YNN 9,391.04 1,425.63 -1,905.14 2,123.75 0.94 0.94 MWD
OH 9,917.0 12.06 315.06{ YNN 9,480.84 1,439.79 -1,919.27 2,140.13 1.09 -1.09 MWD
OH 10,011.0 10.94 312.31| YNN 9,572.95 1,452.74 -1,932.81 2,155.71 1.33 -1.19 MWD
OH 10,104.0 9.75 311.43| YNN 9,664.44 1,463.89 -1,945.24 2,169.89 1.2 -1.28 MWD
OH 10,196.0 9.00 310.43| YNN 9,755.21 1,473.72 -1,956,55 2,182.74 0.83 -0.82 MWD
OH 10,220.0 6.81 324.81| YNN 9,848.32 1,483.04 -1,965.36 2,193.03 312 233 MWD
OH 10,383.0 6.08 32356 YNN 9,940.73 1,491.50 -1,971.46 2,200.50 0.82 -0.81 MWD
OH 10,477.0 5.56 316.43] YNN 10,034.25 1,498.79 -1,977.54 2,207.76 0.83 -0.53 MWD
OH 10,571.0 4.38 31431 YNN 10,127.89 1,504.59 -1,983.25 2,214.39 1.27 -1.26 MWD
OH 10,665.0 3.13 323.18/ YNN 10,221.69 1,500.16 -1,987.36 2,219.23 1.46 -1.33 MWD
OH 10,758.0 225 327.43) YNN 10,314.59 1,512.73 -1,980.86 2,222.31 0.97 -0.95 MWD
OH 10,820.0 0.63 21.08] YNN 10,376.57 1,514.07 -1,890.40 2,223.07 3.14 261 MWD
OH 11,001.0 1.70 139.28] YNN 10,647.53 1,512.42 -1,887.24 2,219.67 0.77 0.39 MSS
OH 11,245.0 260 101.68| YNN 10,801.43 1,500.98 -1,962.33 2,214.41 1.06 0.58 MSS
OH 11,724.0 4.10 93.08| YNN 11,279.60 1,506.86 -1,954.59 2,186.55 0.33 0.31 MSS
o1 10,428.0 575 316.81| YNN 10,410.50 381.18 -357.83 381.18 0.08 0.06 MWD
o1 10,433.0 5.81 31543 YNN 10,415.48 381.54 -358.18 381,54 3.03 1.20 MWD
o1 10,440.0 5.75 314.81| YNN 10,422.44 382,04 -358.67 382.04 1.24 0.86
o1 10,383.0 6.08 32356 NYN 9,940.73 1,491.50 -1,971.46 2,200.50 0.00 0.00 MWD
o1 10,428.0 575 316.81) YNN 9,985.49 1,495.05 -1,974.41 1,495,05 1.69 -0.69 MWD
01 10,433.0 5.81 315.43| YNN 9,990.47 1,495.42 -1,974.76 1,495.42 3.03 1.20 MWD
o 10,440.0 5.75 314.81| YNN 9,997.43 1,495.92 -1,975.26 1,495.92 1.24 -0.86 MWD
o1 10,465.0 575 307.56| YNN 10,022.31 1,497.56 -1,977.14 1,497.56 2.90 0.00 MWD
o1 10,480.0 556 301.31| YNN 10,037.23 1,498.40 -1,978.36 1,498.40 429 -1.27 MWD
o1 10,496.0 550 291.08] YNN 10,053.16 1,499.08 -1,979.74 1,490.08 6.18 0.38 MWD
o1 10,511.0 5.56 280.68, YNN 10,068.09 1,499.47 -1,981.12 1,490.47 6.67 0.40 MWD
01 10,528.0 575 266.31] YNN 10,085.01 1,490.57 -1,082.78 1,499.57 8.38 112 MWD
01 10,560.0 5.88 25768/ YNN 10,116.84 1,499.11 -1,985.98 1,499.11 278 0.41 MWD
o1 10,5920 431 261.62| YNN 10,148.72 1,498.59 -1,988.77 1,488.59 5.02 -4.91 MWD

Printed: 3/17/2008 3:23:39 PM
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Deviation Summary
Well Name: FR 7P-36-14-19 Location: 36- 14-S 19-E 26 SIT# V.8. AZI (%)
TMD: 12,074.0 (ft) TVD: 11,629.44 (1t) Spud Date: 2/5/2007 OH 280.00
Closure Distance: 2,499.6 (ft) Closure Direction: 307.57 (°) Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature o1 0.00
SIT# TMD Angle Azimuth CT™M TVD N/-S E-W Vert. Section DLS BUR Type
(") ) () () () ®) ") (°/100ft) (*1100m)

o1 10,623.0 2.81 260.31| YNN 10,179.66 1,498.41 -1,990.68 1,498.41 5.07 -4.84 MWD

01 10,654.0 244 284.18| YNN 10,210.62 1,498.56 -1,892.08 1,498.56 249 -1.18

01 10,687.0 2.75 289.56! YNN 10,243.59 1,489.00 -1,893.51 1,499.00 1.19 0.94

01 10,719.0 2.94 201.81| YNN 10,275.55 1,499.56 -1,995.00 1,499.56 0.69 0.59

o1 10,751.0 294 290.18| YNN 10,307.51 1,500.15 -1,986.53 1,500.15 0.26 0.00

01 10,783.0 2.75 288.81| YNN 10,339.47 1,500.68 -1,998.03 1,500.68 0.63 -0.59

o1 10,815.0 2.38 203.06 YNN 10,371.44 1,501.19 -1,999.36 1,501.19 1.30 -1.16

o1 10,847.0 1.81 299.06| YNN 10,403.41 1,501.69 -2,000.42 1,501.69 1.91 -1.78

01 10,897.0 1.38 300.93| YNN 10,453.39 1,502.39 -2,001.62 1,502.39 0.87 -0.86

01 10,910.0 1.44 301.81| YNN 10,466.39 1,502.55 -2,001.90 1,502.55 0.49 0.46

01 10,9420 1.38 202.43| YNN 10,498.38 1,502.91 -2,002.59 1,502.91 0.74 .19

01 10,960.0 1.13 301.43| YNN 10,516.38 1,503.09 -2,002.85 1,503.09 1.76 -1.39

01 11,006.0 0.94 289.68| YNN 10,562.37 1,503.45 -2,003.69 1,503.45 0.62 0.4

o1 11,033.0 0.88 303.93| YNN 10,580.37 1,503.64 -2,004.07 1,503.64 0.86 022

o1 11,070.0 0.81 297.93| YNN 10,626.36 1,503.92 -2,004.54 1,503.92 0.30 0.19

o1 11,004.0 0.81 308.06| YNN 10,650.36 1,504.11 -2,004.82 1,504.11 0.60 0.00

01 11,3420 1.00 338.88| YNN 10,898.33 1,507.21 -2,006.98 1,507.21 0.21 008/ - Mss

01 11,756.0 2.80 51.68) YNN 11,312.13 1,516.85 -2,000.35 1,516.85 0.65 0.43 MSS

o1 12,074.0 4.80 79.58| YNN 11,620.44 1,524.07 -1,881.16 1,524.07 0.84 0.63 MsS

Printed: 3/17/2008 3:23:39 PM




Prepared By: Updated on 12/15/07 D. Caldwell Date: 12/15/07

FIELD: Flat Rock GL: 7443 'KBE: 7,465’ Spud Date: 2/5/07 _ Completion date:  11/12/07
Well:  FR 7P-36-14-19 TD: 12,485 * PBTD: 12,414 * Current Well Status:
Location - Surface: NWSW Sec. 31, T14S, R20E Reason for Pull/Workover:
Location - Bottom hole: SWNE Sec. 3, T14S, R19E Initial Completion
API#:43-047- 38992 Utntah County, Utah
Wellbore
Schematic Tubing Landing Detail;
Description Size Footage Depth
KB 22.00 22.00
Surface casing . Hanger 7 1/16° Bowl style 118 23.18
Size: 13 3/8° g ; 328 fts. 238" 1064280 _ 10,6658
Weight: 48 # i1 - F-nipple w/1.81" ID 2-3/8" 091  10,666.88
Grade:  H-40 g 14t 2-3/8" 3253 10,699.42
Set@ 502 ] } Pump-off sub ' 095 _10,70038
Cmtd w/ 665 sks class G} | : EOT @ 10,700.38
Hole size: 17-1/2° af ;
. Tubing Information:
' Congdition;
“ g . New: _ 00 Used: Wellhead 7-1/16 10 K
1 '} TOC ® Unavailable Grade: Paos
i ‘ Welght (#/ft): Ar8
Wingate: 1 ]0  Dakota Siit: 3-spf SUMMARY:
12,292' - 12,300' 1 10,742, - 10,758’ Stage 1 - Perf Wingate 12316-24' & 12292-12300". Broke down perfs
12.316'- 12,324’ . § Dakota: 3-spf 12292’ - 12324' w/ 1000 gais of 15% HCL Acid
i 10,888 - 10,889 Frac 12292' - 12324’ w/ 43,000# sand. _
CIBP @ 12,260 § Cedar Mountaln: 3-spf Set 5-1/2° CIBP @ 12260 to shut off Wi
10,918 - 10,928' 2 - Perf Entrada 12068-70', 11992-94), 11987-89", 11977-79,
g, 10,946' - 10,950° _11948-52", 11926-28' & 11911-13",
Entrada: 3-spf Acidize 11911' - 12070 w/ 1000 gals of 15% HCL Acid
1 11,830' - 11,844' Stage 2 Cont. - Perf Entrada 11851-68', 11830-44',
11,851' - 11,868' Acidize 11830' - 12070° w/ 1000 gals of 15% HCL Acid
11911'- 11,913 Frac 11830' - 12070' w/ 90,600# sand & 1,671 MSCF N2.
11,926' - 11,928° Stoge 3 - Perf Cedar Mt 10946- 50' & 10918-26' & Dakotn 10383.00° |
11,948' - 11,952 [rac Cedar Min/Dakota w/ 95,0004 sand,
11,977 - 11,979 Swaged - Parf Dakota St 10742-58'. Fracw/37,000¢#sand. |
11,987" - 11,989'
11,992 - 11,994
12,068' - 12,070°
i
. :
5
.
&
=
g
NOTES:
Intermediate: Cement w/ 688 - sks_50/50 Pz, Foamed 85 bjgal |
£ 134 -3ks 50/50 Poz, Foamed 11.0 b/gal
E 172 - sks 50/50 Poz 143 Ibjgal
= TOC w/ 75 - sks class G
Production: Cement w 1250 - sks 50 Foamed 11 Ib/gal
90 -sks 50/50 Poz, Unfoamed 14.31Mbjgal |
FNppe @ 10667 °
EOT @ 10700 *
Production Casing
Size: 5Y2" Sand @ 12,161'
Weight 17# CIEP @ 12,260
Grade: P-110
Set @ 12,468' PBID® 12,414' ~a n
£, 2, CONFIDENTIAL
Hole size:  7-5/8” ™me 12485 * o8l R i




Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET  (for state use only) [ cow ]
Change of Operator (Well Sold) ' X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010
FROM: (01d Operator): TO: (New Operator):
N5085-Questar Exploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company
1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265
Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048
CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG|API NO ENTITY |LEASE TYPE|WELL |WELL
NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. s the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5¢. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet

7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC'") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP Enerav FORM A xIs 06/30/2010



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES '
DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER.

See attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS © o DA, ALLOTTER OR TRISE Nawe

See attached

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells betow current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to S eo attach e d
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER
OiL WELL AS LL OTHE
L GasweLL [] HER See attached
2 NAME OF OPERATOR: ~ 9. AP| NUMBER:
Questar Exploration and Production Company /V j ﬁ b’ 5 Attached
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street, Suite 500 . Denver erare CO L. 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE. See attached county: Attached
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH
11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ acioize [ oeeren [] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
1 nNoTice oF inTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) [] Autercasing [7] FrACTURE TREAT [] sietrack o REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casingrepair [] newconstrucTiON [] TemporaRILY ABANDON
6/14/2010 [] crance To PrREVIOUS PLANS [] oreraTor cHance [] Tusing Repair
[[] cnance Tusing [] Pueanp asanpon [(] ventorrare
[] SsUBSEQUENT REPORT [} crance weLL Name [ puwesack [} water oiseosaL
{Submit Original Form Only)
[T} cHance wew sTatus [[J] eropuction sTARTRESUME) [] water sHuT-0FF
Date of work completion:
[[] cOMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [] recramamion oF wete sie otHer: Operator Name
[] convertweLLTyre ] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12.  DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details inciuding dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This name
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party change of operator is involved. The same
employees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. Al operations will
continue to be covered by bond numbers: \

Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESB000024) /\/ ‘3 719—0

Utah State Bond Number: 865063633 -~

Fee Land Bond Number: *96560363—3-> 9["5@/0 675

BIA Bond Number: 799446 G650/0(, 93

The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As of

June 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described on
the list

NAME (PLEASEP}{;F( Morgan Anderson me Regulatory Affairs Analyst

vl Fndos— oure_6123/2010

SIGNATURE

RECEIVED APPROVED _, /341 2009
JUN 2 8 2010 ([7 7 |

(5/2000) ) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DiViSiOﬂ Of Oﬂ, Gas aﬂd Mining
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING Earlene Russell, Engineering Technician



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)

effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | g |api entity | mineral |type |stat |C
lease
Wr 16G-32-10-17 32 [100S| 170E |4301350370 State |OW [NEW |C
STATE 1 36 | 070S | 240FE |4304715128 5878 State |GW |P
KAYE STATE 1-16 16 | 100S | 230E |4304730609 5395 State |GW |P
TOLL STATION ST 8-36-8-21 36 | 080S | 210E |4304732724 12361 State |GW |S
GB 8A-36-8-21 36 1 080S | 210E 14304733037 12377 | State |GW |P
GB 6-36-8-21 36 | 080S | 210E |4304733038 12378 | State |GW |P
GB 2-36-8-21 36 | 080S | 210E (4304733252 12527 | State |GW |P
GH 1W-32-8-21 32 | 080S | 210E |4304733570 12797 | State |GW |P
GH 3W-32-8-21 32 | 080S | 210E 4304733571 12796 | State |GW |P
GH 5W-32-8-21 32 1 080S | 210E |4304733572 12828 State |GW |P
GH 7W-32-8-21 32 [ 080S | 210E 4304733573 12872 State |GW |P
GH 2W-32-8-21 32 | 080S | 210E |4304733744 13029 | State |GW |P
GH 4W-32-8-21 32 | 080S | 210E |4304733745 13035 State  |GW |P
GH 8W-32-8-21 32 | 0808 | 210E 4304733746 13030 | State |GW |P
OU GB 3W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E 14304733751 13577 | State |GW |P
OU GB 5W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E 4304733752 13570 | State |GW [P
GH 6W-32-8-21 32 | 080S | 210E |4304733753 13036 | State |GW P
OU GB 11W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220FE 14304733754 13582 | State |GW |P
GH 5G-32-8-21 32 1 080S | 210E 4304733866 13037 | State |OW |P
GB 1W-36-8-21 36 | 080S | 210E |4304733944 13439 | State |GW P
WV 2W-2-8-21 02 | 080S | 210E |4304734034 13678 State |GW |P
GB 6W-25-8-21 25 | 080S| 210FE (4304734121 13440 Fee |GW |P
GB 7W-25-8-21 25 10808 | 210E 14304734122 13436 Fee |GW |P
WV 9W-16-7-21 16 | 070S | 210E 4304734324 State |GW |LA
OU GB 11W-30-8-22 30 | 080S | 220F 4304734392 13433 Fee |GW |P
OU GB 4W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E |4304734598 13579 | State |GW [P
OU GB 10W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220F |4304734616 State |GW |LA
OU GB 12W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220F (4304734617 13697 | State |GW |P
OU GB 13W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220F [4304734618 13611 State |GW [P
GB 14MU-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E 4304734619 14196 | State |GW |P
OU GB 15W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E 14304734622 13595 State |GW [P
OU GB 16W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E |4304734655 13815 State | GW |P
OU GB 2W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E 4304734657 13721 State |GW |P
OU GB 6W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E [4304734658 13592 | State |GW |P
OU GB 8§W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E 4304734660 13769 | State |GW |TA
OU GB 9W-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220FE |4304734692 State |GW (LA
OU GB 15G-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E 4304734829 13777 | State |OW |S
GB 7TMU-36-8-21 36 | 080S | 210E (4304734893 14591 State | GW |P
GB 3W-36-8-21 36 | 080S | 210E 4304734894 13791 State |GW |P
NC 8M-32-8-22 32 | 080S | 220E |4304734897 State |GW |LA
NC 3M-32-8-22 32 | 080S | 220E 14304734899 State |GW |LA
GB 5W-36-8-21 36 | 080S | 210E |4304734925 13808 State  |GW |P
GB 4MU-36-8-21 36 | 080S | 210E /14304734926 14589 | State | GW |P
NC 11M-32-8-22 32 | 080S | 220E [4304735040 State |GW LA
GB 5S5G-36-8-21 36 | 080S | 210E |4304735155 14015 State  |GW |P
SC 13ML-16-10-23 16 | 100S | 230E |4304735281 14036 | State {GW |P
SC 3ML-16-10-23 16 | 100S | 230F |4304735282 14014 | State |GW P
SC 11ML-16-10-23 16 | 100S | 230E |4304735311 14035 State |GW [P
WH 13G-2-7-24 02 | 0708 | 240E (4304735484 14176 | State D |PA
FR 9P-36-14-19 31 | 140S | 200E [4304735880 14310 | State |GW |P
CB 13G-36-6-20 36 1060S | 200E [4304735969 State  |OW LA
Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695 1 of 2




Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec| twp | rng |api entity | mineral |type |stat |C
lease
WH 2G-2-7-24 02 | 0708 | 240E 14304736259 State |[GW |LA
WH 4G-2-7-24 02 | 070S | 240F 4304736261 State |GW LA
FR 1P-36-14-19 31 | 1408 | 200E |4304736300 14859 | State |GW |P
WK 3ML-2-9-24 02 | 090S | 240E 14304736723 State |GW |LA
WK 7ML-2-9-24 02 | 0908 | 240E (4304736724 State |GW |LA
SC 5ML-16-10-23 16 | 100S | 230F (4304736877 15125 | State |GW |P
SC 12ML-16-10-23 16 | 100S | 230E |4304736878 15053 | State |GW |P
SC 14ML-16-10-23 16 | 100S | 230E |4304736908 15070 | State |GW |P
SC 4ML-16-10-23 16 | 100S | 230E /4304736912 15208 | State |GW |P
FR 3P-36-14-19 36 | 140S | 190E 14304737376 15736 | State |GW |P
BZ 12ML-16-8-24 16 | 080S | 240E |4304737670 State |GW |LA
BZ 10D-16-8-24 16 | 080S | 240E 14304737671 15979 | State |GW |S
BZ 14ML-16-8-24 16 | 080S | 240E 14304737672 State  |GW |LA
BBE 9W-16-7-21 16 | 070S | 210E |4304737745 State |GW |LA
GB 10ML-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220F |4304737943 State |GW [LA
GB 9ML-16-8-22 16 | 080S | 220E |4304737944 15851 State |GW |P
HR 2MU-2-12-23 02 | 1208 | 230E 4304738052 State |GW LA
HR 3MU-2-12-23 02 1 120S | 230FE /14304738053 State |GW |LA
HR 6MU-2-12-23 02 | 1208 | 230E 4304738054 State |GW |LA
HR 10MU-2-12-23 02 | 120S | 230E |4304738055 15737 | State |GW |S
HR 12MU-2-12-23 02 | 1208 | 230E 4304738056 State |GW |LA
HR 14MU-2-12-23 02 | 120S | 230E |4304738057 State |GW |LA
HR 16MU-2-12-23 02 | 120S | 230E 4304738058 State |GW |LA
FR 11P-36-14-19 36 | 140S | 190E 4304738349 15899 | State |GW |P
GB 45G-36-8-21 36 | 080S| 210E |4304738764 16142 | State |GW |P
GB 75G-36-8-21 36 | 080S | 210E /4304738765 16144 | State |GW |P
WF 3D-32-15-19 32 | 1508 | 190E |4304738877 State |\GW |APD |C
SCS 5C-32-14-19 32 | 140S | 190E |4304738963 16759 | State |GW |P
FR 7P-36-14-19 31 | 140S | 200E |4304738992 15955 | State |GW |P
SCS 10C-16-15-19 16 | 150S | 190E |4304739683 16633 | State |GW |P
IR 6P-16-14-19 16 | 140S | 190E |4304740350 State  |GW _|APD |C
Bonds: BLM = ESB000024
BIA = 956010693
State = 965010695 2 of 2
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