QUESTZR

January 25, 2007

Utah Division of Oil. Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple. Suite 1210
Salt Lake City. Utah 84114-5801

GB #1M-4-8-22R

Section 4-T8S-R22E

Uintah County, Utah

To Whom It May Concern:

In reference to the State Oil and Gas Conservation rule R649-3-3 Questar Exploration
and Production Company’s GB #1M-4-8-22R is an exception to this rule due to
topography.

There are no additional lease owners within 460° of the proposed location. If you have
any questions, please contact Debbie Stanberry at (303) 308-3068, (303) 241-1336 cell.

Thank you.

Sincerely,

Debra K. Stanberry
Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

Attachment.
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RIG SKID

Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) OMB NO. 1004-0137
UNITED STATES txpires: March 31,2007
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Leasc Serial No.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-02510A
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER 6. If indian. Allottec or Tribe Name
n/a
7. I Unitor CA Agreement. Name and No.
la. Type of Work: DRIL]_ DRI—IENTER White River Unit

8. Lease Name and Well No.

Ib. Typeof Well. [ Joit well [X]GasWell [ Jomer  [X]Single Zone [ Multiple Zone  [GB 1M-4-8-22R

2. Name of Operator 9. APl Well No.

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY L'L’?’b (t 7 i 3 ?q ?D
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory

IS71E 1700 8 VERNAL UT 84078 (303) 308-3068 White River

4. Locaton of well {Report Jocation clearly and In accordance with any State requirements.*} 1. Sec, T, R, M..or Blk. And Survey or Arca

At surface L/% 3,(“ )‘ Llo~ 1s 7 (,g‘D

Lot8 1147 FNL x474' FEL

‘ Sec. 4 T8S R22E  SLBM
At proposed prod. zone Uy { = sam! 104. Y4» (f,q‘]j
14. Distance in miles and dircction from the nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State
+/~ 34 miles southeast of Vernal, Utah Uintah Utah
15. Distance from proposcd* 16. No. of acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
location to nearest
property or lease line, fi.
(Also 1o nearest drlg. unit line, if any) 474 907.83 40
18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/ BIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, drilling, completed,
applicd for, on this lease. fi. +/- 1500' 16.700' ESB000024
21. Elevations (Show whether DF. RT, GR. etc.) 22. Aproximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration
graded ground 5168’ immediately upon approval 75 days

24. Atachments

The following. completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. | shall be attached o this form;

L. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor, 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by existing bond on file(see
2. A Drilling Plan. item 20 above).
3. A Surface Usc Plan { if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the | 5. Operator certification.
SUPQO shali be {3#€d pvith the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/ or plans as may be required by the a
/ . ) authorized officer.
Name (Printed: Typed) Debra K. Stanberry Date 112372007
—2
- upervisor, Regulatory (\n‘fh\ /
\ P \“
;i (X i Name (Printed’ Typed) Date
BRADLEY G. HILL Dl-es-0x

OMENVIRONMENTAL MANAGER

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant te ce
operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, il any, are attached.

‘itle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the Unite
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction,

* (Instructions on page 2)

Federal Approval of thie
Action is Nacessary
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

Well location, GB #IM—4—8—22R, located as
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S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah.
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S LoT 1 @ = PROPOSED WELL HEAD. S| 65 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL UTAH 84078
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cop SCALE DATE SURVEYED: | DATE DRAWN:
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Additional Operator Remarks

Questar Exploration and Production Company proposes to drill a well to 16,700' to test the
Mancos. If productive, casing will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well will be
plugged and abandoned as per BLM and State of Utah requirements

See Onshore Order No. 1 attached

Please be advised that Questar Exploration and Production Company agrees to be

responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the
lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No. ESB000024. The principal is Questar
Exploration and Production Company via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR
3104.2.

This well is a replacement well for the GB 1M-4-8-22.



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
GB 1M-4-8-22R
DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth

Uinta Surface
Green River 3,260°
Wasatch 6,560’
Mesaverde 9,295’
Sego 11,650°
Castlegate 11,895°
Blackhawk 12,375’
Mancos Shale 12,775°
Mancos B 13,125°
Frontier 15,900’
TD 16,700°

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearingk Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas. Or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 6,965’
Gas Mesaverde 9,835°
Gas Blackhawk 13,035°
Gas Mancos Shale 13,475
Gas Mancos B 14,060’

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected, samples will



.ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
GB 1M-4-8-22R

DRILLING PROGRAM

be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be
obtained from Wonsits Valley water right # A36125 (which was filed on May 7, 1964,) or
Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined
by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before1989 is not
depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to supply fresh water for drilling purposes.
All water resulting from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash Central
Battery Disposal Site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site;
SWNW, Section 12, T8S, R21E.

3. Operator’s Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 13-5/8” 5000 psi double gate, 5,000 psi annular BOP (schematic included) from
surface hole to 9-5/8” casing point.

B. 117 10,000 psi double gate, 10,000 psi single gate, 10,000 psi annular BOP
(schematic included) from 9-5/8" casing point to total depth.

C. Functional test daily

D. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2 psi/foot or 1500 psi, whichever is
greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed the
internal yield pressure of the casing.

E. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack

working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure of
casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 10M system and individual components shall
be operable as designed.

4, Casing Design:

Hole Csg. Top Botfom Wit. Grade | Thread { Cond.

Size Size (MD) MD)

26" 20" sfc 40-60° | Steel Cond. None | Used
17-1/2” | 13-3/8 sfe 500° 54.5 K-55 STC New
12-1/4" | 9-5/8" sfe 6700 47 | HCP-110 | LTC New




ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1

QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
GB 1M-4-8-22R
DRILLING PROGRAM
8-1/2” 7’ 6000’ | 9000’ 26 | HCP-110 | LTC New
8-1/2" 7" 9000* | 12,000' | 29* | HCP-110 | LTC New
SDrift
6-1/8” | 4-1/2” sfe 13,700 | 15.1 P-110 LTC New
6-1/8" | 4-1/2" | 13,700’ | 16,700' | 15.1 Q-125 LTC New
Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile
(minimum)
13-3/8” [ 54.5 Ib. K-55 STC | 1,130 psi 2,730 psi 547,000 Ib.
9-5/8" | 471b. | HCP-110 | LTC 7,100 psi 9,440 psi 1,213,000 Ib.
7" 261b. | HCP-110 | LTC | 7,800 psi 9,950 psi 693,000 Ib.
7 291b.* | HCP-110 | LTC | 9,200 psi | 11,220 psi 797,000 1b.
4-12" | 15.11b. P-110 LTC | 14,350 psi | 14,420 psi 406,000 1b.
4-1/2" | 15.11b. Q-125 | LTC | 15,840 psi | 16,380 psi 438,000 1b.
* Special Drift
MINIMUM DESIGN FACTORS:
COLLAPSE: 1.125
BURST: 1.10
TENSION: 1.80
Area Fracture Gradient: 0.9 psi/foot

Maximum anticipated mud weight: 15.4 ppg
Maximum surface treating pressure: 12,500 psi

5. Auxiliary Equipment
A. Kelly Cock — yes

Float at the bit—no
Monitoring equipment on the mud system — visually and/or PVT/Flow Show

Full opening safety valve on the rig floor — yes

m o 0 w

Rotating Head — yes



-ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
GB 1M-4-8-22R
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DRILLING PROGRAM
If drilling with air the following will be used:

The blooie line shall be at least 6” in diameter and extend at least 100’ from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling
below 500°).

Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will
be used. It is not intended to use oil in the mud, however, in the event it is used, oil
concentration will be less than 4% by volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 15.4

PPg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

6. Testing, logging and coring program

A.

B.

Cores — none anticipated
DST — none anticipated

Logging - Mud logging - 4500’ to TD
GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density, FMI

Formation and Completion Interval: Mancos interval, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of logs.

Stimulation — Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

7. Cementing Program

20" Conductor:
Cement to surface with construction cement.



.ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDg{ NO. 1
'QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
GB 1M-4-8-22R
DRILLING PROGRAM

13-3/8” Surface Casing: sfc — 500° (MD)
Slurry: 0’ — 500°. 610 sxs (731 cu ft) Premium cement + 0.25 lbs/sk Flocele + 2% CaCl,
Slurry wt: 15.6 ppg, slurry yield: 1.20 ft*/sx, slurry volume: 17-1/2” hole + 100% excess.

9-S/8" Intermediate Casing: sfc - 6700' (MD)

Lead Slurry: 0° — 6,450°. 1374 sks (4040 cu ft) Rockies LT cement + 0.25 1b/sk Flocele.
Slurry wt: 11.5 ppg, Slurry yield: 2.94 ft*/sk, Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 100% excess.
Tail Slurry: 6,450’ — 6,700°. 80 sks (157 cu ft) Rockies LT cement + 0.25 Ib/sk Flocele.
Sturry wt: 13.0 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.99 ft*/sk, Shurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 100% excess.

7" Intermediate Casing: 6000 - 12,000' (MD)

Foamed Lead Slurry 2: 6,000’ — 11,500°. 540 sks (1046 cu ft) 50/50 Poz Premium + 5
1b/sk silicalite compacted light weight additive + 20% SSA-1 additive + 0.3% FDP-C766-
05 fluid loss + 0.2% Versaset thixotropic additive + 1.5% Zonesealant 2000 foamer.
Slurry wi: 14.3 ppg, foamed 11.5 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.48 ft*/sk, Slurry yield foamed: 1.96
ft’/sk, Slurry volume: 8-1/2" hole + 50% excess.

Tail Shurry: 11,500° — 12,000°. 42 sks (70cu ft) of 50/50 Poz Premium + 5 Ib/sk
silicalite compacted light weight additive + 20% SSA-1 additive + 0.3% FDP-C766-05
fluid loss + 0.2% Versaset thixotropic additive. Slurry wt: 14.3 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.48
ft*/sk, Slurry volume: 8-1/2" hole + 50% excess.

Top Out Cement: 75 sks (117 cu ft) Premium cement + 10 Ib/sk gilsonite + 12% Cal-
Seal 60 + 3% CaCl,.

4-1/2" Production Casing: sfc - 16,700' (MD)

Lead/Tail Sharry: 6,500 - 16,700". 995 sks (1630 cu ft) Premium Cement + 0.5% HR-12
retarder + 35% SSA-1 + 0.2% Suspend HT + 0.4% Halad(R)-344 fluid loss + 0.3%
Halad(R)-413 fluid loss + 0.4% Super CBL gas migration + 0.2% HR-25 retarder. Slurry
wt: 15.25 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.64 ft'/sk, Slurry volume: 6-1/8” hole + 25% in open hole
section.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface on the intermediate string and 5,000’ on the production
string. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and across zones as required by
the authorized officer to insure protection of natural resources.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 13,400 psi. Maximum
anticipated bottom hole temperature is 320° F.
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" QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
GB 1M-4-8-22R

13 5/8" Rotating Head

13 5/8" 5M Spacer Spool

135" o At 1 r
!
—

13 5/8" 5M Double Ram

DRILLING PROGRAM

|

Flowline
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" QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
GB 1M-4-8-22R

DRILLING PROGRAM

spacer spool is nippled down and an 1
section is nippled up. The 11* 10K sta
section. .

9 stack arangement with the 7* liner hanger allows an 11" stack to fit in the|
sub of Ensign 24 and True 32. This arrangement requires using a 5000 psi13-
double gate stack until the 9-5/8" is set. After the 3-5/8" casing is set, a

3-5/4" 5000 psi x 13-58" 18,000 psi "B"|
ck is nippled up on top of the "B"

BOP Requitements:

11" Rotating Head

11" M Spacer Spool

11" 10M Annular

11" 10M Double Ram

11" 10M Mud Cross

EEU:DJ

11" 10M Single Ram

G.L

Terg

I Mat Board |

-

o, SR

"

L]
13-5/8" 5SMx 11" 10M Multi-Bowl "B" Sect F.‘
= =

13-5/8" 5M “A" Section

13-3/8" 54 5# K55 Casing

QEP I'Wexpro




QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
GB 1M-4-8-22R
1147! "FNL x 4741 FUL
LOT 8, SECTION 4, T8S, R22E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-02510-A

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1
MULT! — POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

An onsite inspection was conducted for the GB 1M-4-8-22 on July 20, 2006 . Weather conditions
were warm and clear at the time of the onsite. In attendance at the inspection were the following individauls:

Paul Buhler Bureau of Land Management
Dixie Sadlier Bureau of Land Management
Jan Nelson QEP Uinta Basin Inc.

1. Existing Roads:

The proposed well site is approximately 34 miles southeast of Vernal, Utah.
Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 — mile radius.

There will be no improvements made to existing roads.

2. Planned Access Roads:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices dated October 18, 2005, for
Mesa Verde Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River,
Glen Bench, and Undesignated fields in Townships 07, 08 and 09 South, Ranges 21 to 25 East.

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.
The proposed access road is under Right-Of-Way UTU-81241.
3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 — Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.
4. Location of Existing & Proposed Fagilities:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices dated October 18, 2005, for
Mesa Verde Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River,
Glen Bench, and Undesignated fields in Townships 07, 08 and 09 South, Ranges 21 to 25 East.

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.
The proposed pipeline is under Right-Of-Way UTU-81262.

QEP requests a surface pipeline based on the following justification included in the
attached "Request for Exception”.



10.

Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices dated October 18, 2005, for
Mesa Verde Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River,
Glen Bench, and Undesignated fields in Townships 07, 08 and 09 South, Ranges 21 to 25 East.

Source of Construction Materials:

Piease see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices dated October 18, 2005, for
Mesa Verde Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River,
Glen Bench, and Undesignated fields in Townships 07, 08 and 09 South, Ranges 21 to 25 East.

Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices dated October 18, 2005, for
Mesa Verde Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River,
Glen Bench, and Undesignated fields in Townships 07, 08 and 09 South, Ranges 21 to 25 East.

Ancillary Facilities:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices dated October 18, 2005, for
Mesa Verde Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River,
Glen Bench, and Undesignated fields in Townships 07, 08 and 09 South, Ranges 21 to 25 East.

Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills
and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailer parking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig arientation, parking areas, and access roads.

A pit liner is required. A felt pit liner will be required if bedrock is encountered.

Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices dated October 18, 2005, for
Mesa Verde Formation Wells located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River,
Glen Bench, and Undesignated fields in Townships 07, 08 and 09 South, Ranges 21 to 25 East.

interim Reclamation

Please see attached Interim Reclamation plan.

Once the well is put onto production, QEP will reclaim as much of the well pad as possible that will allow
for operations to continue in a safe and reasonable manner. Reseeding will be done in the spring or fall
of every year to allow winter precipitation to aid in the succuss of reclamation.
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Seed Mix:

Interim Recfamation:

9 Ibs Hycrest Crested Wheatgrass

3ibs Forage Kochia

Final Reclamation:

Seed Mix# 5 4 Ibs. Gardner Saltbush, 4 Ibs. Hycrest Crested Wheat Grass, 4 Ibs. Shadscale

Surface Ownership:
Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East

Vernal, Utah 84078

(435) 781-4400

Other Information

A Ciass il archaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology
Consultants. A copy of this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by

Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended
for this location.

A class ll paleontological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeolory Consultants. A copy of

this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by Rod Scheetz.

The inspection resulted in the location of no fossil resources, However, suggest the construction be monitored
while construction is disturbing the Myton Member of the Uinta Formation. QEP will provide paleo monitor.

There is a Ferruginous Hawk Stipulation from March 1st to July 15th. No construction or drilling will
commence during this period unless otherwise determined by a wildlife biologist that the site is inactive.

QEP will construct reservoir near corner # 3. Install culvert as spillway. Reroute drainage around corner # 2.
Install cuivert as needed, use minimum 18" culvert. Contact Paul Buhler with BLM before construction begins.



Lessee’s or Operator’s Representative:

Debra K. Stanberry
Questar Exploration and Production Company
Denver, Colorado
(303) 308-3068

Certification:

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved
plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

Questar Exploration and Production Company will be fully responsible for the actions of their subcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drill will be furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all
construction and drilling operations.

I hereby certify that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by Questar Exploration and Production Company, its’ contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. This statement is
subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

23-Jan-07

Debra K. Stanberry™
Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs
Questar Exploration and Production Company

T~ Date
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
GB #1M-4-8-22R

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE ‘AMERA ANGLE: NORTHWESTERLY

= |

I

|

[PROPOSED ACCESE

OM BE CAMERAANGLE: SOUTHEASTERLY

l\]r;\{SUintah Engineering & Land Surveying LocatioN pHotos 101114103 PHOTO

GINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS

85 South 200 East  Vernal, Utah 84078 N MONTH] DAY | ¥EAR
435-789-1017 wvels@uelsine.com TAKEN BY: D.K. | DRAWN BY: EM. | REV: 06-23-06 L.K.




QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

. TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR .
“Scdle GB #IM-4-8-22R S LD 5

| FIGURE #2]

",
. N Syt
i I SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. ss\é" &,
=100 1147° FNL 474’ FEL | £8/ vo. 10139 \o2
DATE: 06-22-06 . §E ROBE g
Drawn By: D.R.B. Y \ §
REVISED: 01-23--07 S.L. 9" \ §
| 100 150 i I,” i \“ ™

P L Sy, Tt
D Y .

Finlshed Grade\ l

T

-] J
\\_i cur '
STA. 0+00
NOTE:

Topsoll should not be

Stripped Below Finished » NOTE:

Grade on Substructure Area. FILL QUANTITY INCLUDES
5% FOR COMPACTION

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL
CUT

= 4,770 Cu. Yds.
Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 4,170 Cu. Yds.
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 2320 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)
Remaining Location = 10,620 Cu. Yds. EXCESS UNBALANCE =0 Cu. Yds.
TOTAL CUT = 72940 CU.YDS. (After Interim Rehabilitation)
FILL = §770 CU.YDS.

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. 200 Kast * Vernal, Ulah 84078 * (486) 7891017
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. [ FICURE #3[
INTERIM RECLAMATION PLAN FOR y 1
GB #IM—4-8-22R
SECTION 4, T8S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
1147° FNL 474’ FEL

SCALE: 1" = 60’

DATE: 06-22-06 r
Drawn By: D.R.B.
REVISED: 01-23-07 S.L.

// INTERIM RECLAMATION
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. 200 Zast * Vernal, Uiah 84078 * (435) 7891017
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. WORKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 01/24/2007

WELL NAME: GB 1M-4-8-22R (RIGSKID)
OPERATOR : QUESTAR EXPLORATION & ( N5085 )
CONTACT : DEBRA STANBERRY

PROPOSED LOCATION:
NENE 04 0808 220E

SURFACE: 11%] FNL 0474 FEL
BOTTOM: 11@1 FNL. 0474 FEL
COUNTY : UINTAH

LATITUDE: 40.15765 LONGITUDE: -109.4365
UTM SURF EASTINGS: 633161 NORTHINGS: 4446217
FIELD NAME: WHITE RIVER ( 705 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal
LEASE NUMBER: UTU-02510A
SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal

API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-38990

PHONE NUMBER: 303-308-3068

INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
Tech Review Initials Date
Engineering

Geology

Surface

PROPOSED FORMATION: MNCS

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED:

Plat
Bond: Fed[1] Ind{l Stal] Feel]
(No. ESB000024 )
Potash (Y/N)
0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13
Water Permit
(No. 49-2153 )
RDCC Review (Y/N)
(Date: )

= REHE AR

kiF Fee surf Agreement (Y/N)

MB  Intent to Commingle (Y/N)

Unit:

R649-3-2.

v/ R649-3-3.

Drilling Unit

R649-3-11.

LOCATION AND SITING:

R649-2-3.

WHITE RIVER

General
Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Exception

Board Cause No:
Eff Date:
Siting:

Directional Drill

COMMENTS :

\
KS}, 2, &.pun w L 0

ugw/

STIPULATIONS:

Z (\~§\ﬁ btb K( \Sh |0




RWU 159
14-33A) T
WONSITS 2 RWU 163 34 AMU
ST 832~ G433A)
w14 T7S R22E
T8S R22E
1
WRU 6 OUGB . WRU 10 (41-4D)
WYl s o 2MU-1-8-22 l >
WY IW ‘ %73 W-4822
ouGB GB IM—-8-22 Ol GB-
4W-4-8-22 = AMU-3-8-22
~ GB IM-4+%-22R
|l URIGSK D)
WRU 8
WRU 11 (32-4D)
LAt e OUGB . “ OUGB .
STIRRUP U OUGB © 6W-4-8-22 SMU-4-8-22
BW-5-8-22 SW-4-8-22 OuGE
WV SMU-3-8-22
AML-5-8-22 OU GB. x
D TMU-4-8-22
WRU 12
) 4
. WV W-58.22
L wvuz OU GB ou GB
STIRRUP U 12W-4-8-22 1w-4-8-22
9G-5-8-22
- WHITE RIVER HELD
(B WHITE RIVER UNIT
STIRRUP U
16W-5-8:22
WHITE WHITE RIVER 29-3
WR <o RIVER 3I1-4 T
23’3?8:22 14W-4-8-22 ® WRU 13W-3-8-22
I
ou GB
i ZMUZ,8.22. ou GB
\. 8- Ou GB IMU-9-8-22
WV IW-8-8-22 Zoa St .
4W-Y9-8-22 '
WHITE - OUGB
RIVER U 25-9 4MU-10-8-22
]
OPERATOR: QUESTAR EXPL & PROD (N5085)
SEC: 4 T.8S R.22E &
~Yl 2\
FIELD: WHITE RIVER (705) ! 2
COUNTY: UINTAH /—vy&_\\\
Wells Stat
SPACING: R649-3-3 / EXCEPTION LOCATION s (5;AS ]‘:JECHON Ut 2 h 0 I I G 25 an d M l n I n
&1
;3 GAS STORAGE g
X LOCATION ABANDONED
® NEW LOCATION N
Field Status UnitES):la)ttlé — < PLUGGED & ABANDONED ;
ABANDONED y¢ PRODUCING GAS
E ACTIVE I GE ® PRODUCING OIL
~| COMBINED NF SECONDARY g FIUIEINICHS W )
o SHUT-IN OIL E
[ INACTIVE L_IHENDING TEMP. ABANDONED
~ PROPOSED ] Prom K TEST WELL
[~ STORAGE CJPPGAS 2
~ TERMINATED PP GEOTHERML 4 WATER INJECTION &
= [ PPOIL @ WATER SUPPLY PREPARED BY: DIANA MASON
[] SECONDARY 4 WATER DISPOSAL DATE: 25-JANUARY-2007
[ TERMINATED = DRILLING




State of Utah
Department of

Natural Resources

MICHAELR. STYLER

Executive Director

Division of

Oil, Gas & Mining

JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

January 25, 2007

Questar Exploration & Production Company
1571 E 1700 S
Vernal, UT 84078

Re: GB 1M-4-8-22R Well, 1147 FNL, 474' FEL, NE NE. Sec. 4, T. 8 South,
R. 22 East, Uintah County. Utah

Gentlemen;

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative
approval of the requested exception location is hereby granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-38990.

Sincerely,
Gil Hunt
Associate Director
pab
Enclosures

cc:  Uintah County Assessor (via e-mail)
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 » TTY (801) 538-7458 » www.ogm.utah.gov



Operator: Questar Exploration & Production Company

Well Name & Number GB 1M-4-8-22R

API Number: 43-047-38990

Lease: ' UTU-02510A

Location: NE NE Sec. 4 T. _8 South R. 22 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 ef seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
. Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

N

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
. Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

W

. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

>

State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

bt

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.



Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
' BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT ’ Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Seriai No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU 02510A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. n/a
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Typeof Well White River Unit

DOH Well Gas Well DOIher 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator GB 1M-4-8-22R
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) !
1571 E 1700 S 43-047-38990
VERNAL UT 84078 303-308-3068 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R, M., or Survey Description) Lat. 40.157594 White River
1147" 474" 11. County or Parish, State
Lot 8 4 T8S R22E Long. 109.437242
° FNL _FEL ne UINTAH UTAH
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

D Notice of Intent D Acidize D Deepen D Production ( Start/ Resume) D Water Shut-off
DAltering Casing DFracturc Treat DReclamation DWell Integrity
Subsequem Report DCasing Repair DNew Construction DRecomplete Othcr

DChange Plans Dl’lug and abandon DTemporarily Abandon SURFACE CASING

DFinal Abandonment Notice E]Conven to Injection DPlug back DWater Disposal CEMENTING PROGRAM

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths or pertinent markers and sands.
Attach the Bond under which the work will performed or provide the Bond No. on file with the BLM/ BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notice shall be filed only afer all requirements, including reclamantion, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

THIS WELL IS A REPLACEMENT WELL. DUE TO THE EXTRAORDINARY CIRCUMSTANCES, QUESTAR
WAS NOT ABLE TO USE ITS NORMAL SERVICE COMPANY FOR THIS WORK. HALLIBURTON ENERGY
SERVICES WAS AVAILABLE AND PUMPED THE ATTACHED CEMENT SLURRY TO SET SURFACE CASING
[N THIS WELL. THIS CEMENT PROGRAM VARIES FROM THE APPROVED APD BUT IS EQUAL TO OR
BETTER THAN THE CEMENT SLURRY PROPOSED IN OUR APD.

Please contact Debbie Stanberry at 303-308-3068 with questions or if you need additional informGRECE ] VE D
JAN 3 1 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. [ hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed’ Typed)

Debra K. Stanberry ) )f ) Regulatory Affairs Supervisor

Signature
January 30, 2007

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant of]
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease] Office
which would entitle the applicant to  conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 US.C. Section 100 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent or repr jons as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)



HALLIBURTON

Questar Exploration And Prod
PO Box 45601
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0601

Glen Bench 1M4-8-2201p4-8-22 £
Glen Bench Field

Uintah County, Utah

United States of America

~——
. -

Surface Casing
Recommendation

Prepared for: Jim Davidson
January 23, 2007
Version: 1

Submitted by:

Rory Cook

Halliburton Energy Services
1085 E Main

Vernal, Utah 84078
435.789.2550 HALLIBURTON

Proposal Questar 1D 4-8-22 v.1




HALLIBURTON

Job Information

Surface Casing

Glen Bench 11 4-8-22/

17.5" Open Hole
Inner Diameter
Job Excess

Surface Casing
QOuter Diameter
Inner Diameter
Linear Weight

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PROD EBIZ

1D 4-8-22

0 - 500 ft (MD)
17.500 in
100 %

0 - 500 ft (MD)
13.375 in
12.615 in
54.50 Ibm/ft

Glen Bench 1D 4-8-22 1D 4-8-22



HALLIBURTON

Calculations Surface Casing
Spacer:
Total Spacer = 112.29 ft’
= 20.00 bbl
Cement : (500.00 ft fill)
500.00 ft * 0.6946 ft*/ft * 100 % = 694.64 ft’
Lead Cement = 694.64 ft’
= 123.72 bbl
Shoe Joint Volume: (0.00 ft fill)
0.00 ft * 0.868 ft'/ft = 0.00 ft’
= 0.00 bbl
Tail plus shoe joint 694.64 ft’
= 123.72 bbl
Total Tail = 500 sks
Total Pipe Capacity:
500.00 ft * 0.868 ft’/ft = 433.98 ft’
= 77.30 bbl

Displacement Volume to Shoe Joint:
Capacity of Pipe - Shoe Joint

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PROD EBIZ

77.30 bbl - 0.00 bbl

77.30 bbl

Glen Bench 1D 4-8-22 1D 4-8-22



HALLIBURTON

Job Recommendation

Surface Casing

Fluid Instructions
Fluid 1: Water Based Spacer

Gel Fluid Density: 8.40 Ibm/gal

Fluid Volume:

Fluid 2: Cement

Premium Plus Cement Fluid Weight

94 Ibm/sk Premium Plus Cement (Cement) Slurry Yield:
0.2 % Versaset (Thixotropic Additive) Total Mixing Fluid:
0.125 Ibm/sk Poly-E-Flake (Lost Circulation Additive) Top of Fluid:
Calculated Fill:

Volume:

Calculated Sacks:
Proposed Sacks:

Fluid 3: Water Spacer

Displacement Fluid Density:
Fluid Volume:

Fluid 4: Top Out Cement
Premium Plus Cement Fluid Weight
94 lbm/sk Premium Plus Cement (Cement) Slurry Yield:
Total Mixing Fluid:

Proposed Sacks:

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PROD EBIZ

20 bbl

14.50 lbm/gal
1.39 ft'/sk
6.78 Gal/sk
0ft

500 ft

123.72 bbl
499.74 sks
500 sks

8.33 lbm/gal
77 bbl

14 Ibm/gal
1.51 ft'/sk
7.71 Gal/sk
200 sks

Glen Bench 1D 4-8-22 1D 4-8-22



HALLIBURTON

Job Procedure

Surface Casing

Detailed Pumping Schedule

Fluid # Fluid Fluid Name Surface Estimated | Downhole
Type Density Avg Rate Volume
lbm/gal bbl/min
1 Spacer  Spacer - Wbm 8.4 20 bbl
2 Cement Lead Cement 14.5 5.0 500 sks
3 Spacer  Displacement Fluid 83 77 bbl
4 Cement Top Out Cement 14.0 3.0 200 sks
8

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PROD EBIZ

Glen Bench 1D 4-8-22 1D 4-8-22
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UINTA BASIN - OPERATIONS REPORT — 1/17/07 — 1/31/07

CONFIDENTIAL - ‘TIGHT HOLE’ Q,Q/P
“Drilling Activity Only”: 4 CB S 2—2 @
Moo True32-GBIM4822R 4% - 047- 2890

A l 071 Spud Date: 1/01/07
Currently drilling @ 1544’as of 1/31/07
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NFIDERTIAL

QuestarE & P Page 1 of 8
Operations Summary Report
T [4
Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R( /%W Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: TRUE L/g.d 4/7,_3 8 ?70 Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSol::lbe Description of Operations
1/24/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 200/LOC |4 RIG DOWN TO SKID RIG FOR TRUCKS
08:00 - 10:00 2.00 RIG UP CRAINE, TRUCKS TO PULL FRONT TWO MATS
10:00 - 15:30 550{LOC |4 DIG CELLAR IN STALL RING
15:30 - 17:00 150{LOC |4 SLID RIG 10' AHEAD W/ 4 TRUCKS, CRAINE , 2 D-8 CATS
17:00 - 00:00 7.00/LOC |4 RIG BACK UP FRONT YARD
00:00 - 06:00 6.00/ TRP |1 PICK UP DP STAND IN DERRICK
1/25/2007 | 06:00 - 10:00 400/LOC |4 SET GAS BUSTER, CHOKE HOUSE IN W/ CRAIN, FLOW LINE
10:00 - 12:00 2.00 TRYING TO SCREW IN TO BHA STANDING DERRICK
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 KICK PUMPS IN FROZE IN TOP DRIVE
13:00 - 16:00 3.00 STAND BHA BACK IN DERRICK TOP DRIVE BACK OUT DRILL PIPE IN TOP OF
MONEL DC HAD TO GET SCREWED BACK IN MONEL DC
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| RIG 5 UNTHAW TOP DRIVE IN UPPER KELLY COCK
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| TRP |1 PICK UP BHA
18:00 - 21:00 3.00/DRL |1 SPUD IN 17 1/2 HOLE @ 1800 1/24/2007 DRILLING F/21 TO 47"
21:00 - 22:00 100|RIG (2 TIGHT UP STAND PIPE UNION
22:00 - 02:30 450(DRL |1 DRILL F/ 47 TO 258
02:30 - 05:00 250/ TRP |2 LAY DOWN 6 DP, TO 2 STD 6 5/8 HWD
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{ REAM |1 WASH 80' TO BOTTOM
1/26/2007 | 06:00 - 06:30 050/ SUR |1 SURVEY @ 261 1.2 DEG 54.0 AZ
06:30 - 10:30 400/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 258 TO 350
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 CLEAN OUT SUCTION&DISCHARGE LINE ON CELLAR PUMP
11:00 - 11:30 0.50|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 350 TO 374
11:30 - 12:30 1.00|TRP |2 L/D 5 JTS. PIPE & RUN IN 6 5/8 HWD
12:30 - 16:30 400/DRL |1 DRILLING F/374 TO 526'
16:30 - 17:00 050/SUR |1 SURVEY @476' 1.7 DEG 39.4 AZ
17:00 - 18:30 1.50{TRP |14 SHORT TRIP TO BIT( SLM BOARD 526.0 STRAP 528.33 NO CORR.)
18:30 - 19:30 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRC. SWEEP AROUND RUN 13 3/8 CSG.
19:30 - 22:00 250/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT RUN 13 3/8 CASING, L/D IBS, SHOCK SUB
22:00 - 00:00 200/CSG |1 RIG UP CASING CREW, CHANGE OUT BAILES ON TOP DRIVE
©0:00 - 03:00 300{CSG |2 RUN 12 JTS 13 5/8 CASING K-55 # 54.5 W/ WESTSTATE CASING
03:00 - 04:00 1.00|CIRC |1 RIG UP CIRC 13 3/8 CSG.
04:00 - 06:00 200/CMT |2 RIG CMT. HELD SAFTY MEETING CMT. 13 3/8 CSG
1/27/2007 | 086:00 - 07:00 1.00|CMT |2 CEMENT 13 3/8 CSG. W/ 500 SK. TYP 3 0.2 VERASET, 1% CALCIUM CHLORID,
0.125#/SK POLYFLACK #14.5 PPG.YIELD 1.40 RETRUNED 9.5 BBL TO PIT
FLOAT HELD.PLUG DOWN @ 06:30 RIG DOWN CEMENTER
07:00 - 12:00 500/ WOT |1 woC
12:00 - 18:00 6.00/BOP |1 CUT OFF PIPE, CHIP CMT DOWN 1 FT. FOR BASE PLATE ON HEAD, WELD ON
HEAD, TEST TO 1,000 PSi
18:00-06:00 | 12.00/BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOPS
1/28/2007  |06:00-19:00 | 13.00{BOP |2 TEST BOPS,HAD RETIGHT ALL FLANGE, TESTED HYDRILL,WING VAVLES,
UNTHAW HCR VALVE,TESTED HCR
19:00 - 20:00 1.00|RIG |2 CHANGE OUT 4 1/2 PIPE RAMS, BLOCKS
20:00 - 22:00 200/BOP |2 TEST UPPER KELLY,
22:00 - 00:00 2.00| RIG 2 FLIP PIPE RAMS OVER
00:00 - 01:00 1.00|BOP |2 CHANGE OUT TEST JT.UNTHAW TOP DRIVE
01:00 - 02:00 1.00|BOP |2 RETEST PIPE RAMS,NO GOOD
02:00 - 06:00 400/RIG |2 NIPPLE DOWN BOPS,WAIT ON NEW DOUBLE GATE FROM QUAIL OUT
CASPER SHOULD BE HEAR @ 12:00 TO DAY
1/29/2007  |06:00-17:00 | 11.00| WOT |4 NIPPE DOWN BOPS , WAIT ON DOUBLE GATE F/ QUAIL IN CASPER,
UNTHAW KELLY HOSE,PUT KELLY HOSE EXT.PIPE ON TO KEEP HOSE OFF
TOP DRIVE
17:00 - 23:00 6.00/BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOPS
23:00 - 06:00 7.00/BOP |2 TEST BOPS PIPE RAMS, BLINDS, CHOKE MANFOILD, WING VALVE, HCR,
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cséldbe Description of Operations
1/29/2007 | 23:00 - 06:00 7.00/BOP |2 CHECK VALVE UPPER, LOEWR KELLY VAVLE, LOW, 250 PSI 5MINS, HIGH
5,000 10 MIN, HY DRILL 250 LOW 5MIN. HIGH 2500 PSI 10 MINS. TEST
CASING TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MINS OK
1/30/2007  |06:00 - 13:30 7.50| RIG 2 NIPPLE DOWN ROTATING HEAD ADD 14" TO SPOOL WAIT ON WELDER,
REDUE SPOOL FOR ROTATING HEAD,INSTALL WEAR BUSHING, DRILL
MOUSE HOLE,
13:30 - 19:00 5.50| RIG 2 NIPPLE UP ROTATING HEAD, HOOK UP FLOW LINE
19:00 - 20:30 150/B0P |1 PUT TRUN BUCKLES ON BOP , CENTER BOP UP TO ROTARY TABLE
20:30 - 00:00 350/ TRP |1 P/ UP BHA
00:00 - 01:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TAGED CMT AT 470"
01:00 - 04:30 350(DRL |1 DRILLING CMT ,FLOAT COLLAR, SHOE, & 10°' NEW HOLE
04:30 - 05:30 1.00{EQT |2 RIG UP, FIT TEST TO 61 PSI = 10.5 MUD WT BLEAD OFF 10 PSI IN 5MINS
TESTED W/ SINGLE JACK TESTING
05:30 - 06:00 050 TRP |3 LAY DOWN SLICK JT . DP , UP SPIRAL HWDP
1/31/2007  |06:00 - 09:30 350[DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 526 TO 720
09:30 - 11:00 150/ CIRC |1 CIRC WHILE WORKING ON PASON EQUIPT.
11:00 - 12:30 1.50|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 720 TO 812
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| OTH CIRC. WORK ON TOP DRIVE STALLING OUT W/ 10,000 WT
13:00 - 13:30 050/DRL  [1 DRILLING F/812 TO 830
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| OTH CIRC. WORK ON TOP DRIVE
14:00 - 15:30 1.50/DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 830 TO 904
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER.
16:00 - 17:30 1.50/DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 904 TO 953
17:30 - 20:00 2.50| OTH WORK ON TOP DRIVE FILLTER COLAPSED
20:00 - 20:30 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 953 TO 1035
20:30 - 21:30 1.00{SUR |1 SURVEY @1,0000 1.6 DEG 352 AZ
21:30 - 01:00 350[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 1035 TO 1147'
01:00 - 02:30 1.50| OTH CIRCULATE AND WORK PIPE WHILE CHANGE OUT FLITERS ON TOP DRIVE
12 FILTERS ALL IN BAD CONDITION.
02:30 - 06:00 350/DRL  [1 DRILL F/ 1147' TO 1250
2/1/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00[DRL {1 DRILLING FROM 1250' TO 1483'
13:00 - 15:30 2.50| RIG 2 WAITTING ON WELDER AND REPAIR STAND PIPE
15:30 - 17:00 150/ DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1483 TO 1514’
17:00 - 18:00 1.00/SUR |1 RAN WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 1444' 1.9 DEG. 37.30 AZI
18:00 - 20:30 250|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1514' TO 1544'
20:30 - 23:00 250|TRP |13 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CASING SHOE DUE TO MOTOR FAILURE ON TOP
DRIVE
23:00 - 03:00 4.00{RIG 2 CHANGE OUT TOP MOTOR ON TOP DRIVE, AND TESTED MOTOR
03:00 - 04:30 150/ TRP |13 TRIP IN HOLE TO 1079"
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 1079 TO 1544'
2122007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1544' TO 1734'
13:00 - 15:30 2.50{ OTH REPAIR PASON
15:30 - 20:30 5.00| RIG 2 WELDER REPAIR DISCHARGE LINE ON PUMP # 2
20:30 - 22:00 150|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1734' TO 1796¢'
22:00 - 23:00 1.00/|CIRC |1 MADE CONNECTION HOLE PACKING OFF BENT TWO JOINTS PIPE
CIRCULATED HI VIS SWEEP
23:00 - 00:30 150|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1796’ TO 1801'
00:30 - 02:00 1.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP CHANGE SWAB #1 PUMP
02:00 - 06:00 4.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM TO 1801’ TO 1920'
2/3/2007 06:00 - 11:00 500(DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1900 TO 2017
11:00 - 11:30 0.50| RIG 1 SERVISE RIGRIG SERVICE
11:30 - 12:00 0.50{ OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD
12:00-22:00 | 10.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2017' TO 2203'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cso?e Description of Operations
2/3/2007 22:00 - 22:30 0.50| OTH REPAIR TOP DRIVE

22:30 - 23:00 0.50; SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 2133’ 1.7 DEG. 36.2 AZM
23:00 - 06:00 7.00, DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 2203 TO 2275’
2/4/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 2275' TO 2309
08:30 - 09:00 0.50| CIRC 1 PUMP SWEEPS AND CIRCULATE
09:00 - 12:30 3.50| TRP 1 TRIP QUT OF HOLE FOR BIT
12:30 - 14:30 2.00| TRP 1 CHANGE OUT BIT AND TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE TOP DRIVE
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE HIT BRIDGE AT 873'
15:30 - 23:00 7.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 873' TO 2164 EXCESSIVE AMOUNTS OF PEE
GRAVEL COMING BACK ACROSS SHALE SHAKERS, RAISING WT AND VIS
CHANGE OUT KELLY SAVER SUB
PACKED OFF WORKING TIGHT HOLE FROM 2164 BACK REAM UP TO
CIRC. AND RAISE WT TO 9.2, VIS TO 40, REAMING TO BOTTOM
WASH AND REAM FROM 2197 TO 2314
DRILLING FROM 2309 TO 2390
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
14:30 - 06:00 15.50| DRL DRILLING FROM 2390 TO 2757
06:00 - NOTE: AFTER RAISING VIS AND WT, TORQUE WENT AWAY
2/6/2007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50| DRL DRILLING FROM 2757 TO 2832
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
10:00 - 12:30 2.50| DRL DRILLING FROM 2832 TO 2895
12:30 - 13:00 0.50/ RIG RIG REPAIR, FILL # 2 PUMP MOTOR WITH ANTIFREEZE
13:00 - 06:00 17.00| DRL DRILLING FROM 2895 TO 3230
2/7/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| DRL DRILLING FROM 3230 TO 3275
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| RIG RIG REPAIR DAY TANK ON # 2 PUMP RAN OUT OF FUEL
07:30 - 10:30 3.00/ DRL DRILLING FROM 3275 TO 3339
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| RIG RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
11:00 - 00:30 13.50| DRL DRILLING FROM 3339 TO 3593
00:30- 01:30 1.00| RIG RIG REPAIR # 2 PUMP, REPLACED VALVE & SEAT IN SUCTION
01:30 - 06:00 4.50/ DRL DRILLING FROM 3593 TO 3664
2/8/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50| DRL DRILLING FROM 3664 TO 3750
10:30- 11:30 1.00| RIG CHANGE OUT MIDDLE DISCHARGE VALVE AND SEAT # 1 PUMP
11:30- 17:00 5.50{ DRL DRILLING FROM 3750 TO 3847
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| RIG RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
18:00 - 19:00 1.00{ DRL DRILLING FROM 3847 TO 3870

23:00 - 00:00 1.00/ RIG
00:00- 05:00 5.00/ TRP
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| CIRC
2/5/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250! REAM
08:30- 14:00 5.50| DRL

o
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19:00 - 21:.00 2.00| TRP 13 PRESSURE LOSS, BIT QUIT DRILLING, LOOKING FOR PRESSURE LOSS
WENT THROUGH BOTH PUMPS

21:00 - 22:00 1.00| TRP 13 MIX UP PILL

22:00 - 22:30 0.50| TRP 13 DROP SURVEY

22:30 - 23:00 0.50| TRP 13 PUMP PILL

23.00-01:30 2.50| TRP 13 TRIP OUT FOR MOTOR

01:30 - 06:00 4.50| TRP 13 TWO 2" HOSES BLEW INTO BETWEEN TOP DRIVE UNIT AND 1/4 WAY UP
DERRICK, WHILE BREAKING OUT SAVER SUB TO PULL OUT HWDP

06:00 - NOTE: HAD 6 TH MAN CHANGE LINERS IN #1 PUMP TO 5 1/2
2/9/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| OTH WORKING ON TESCO TOP DRIVE, REPLACING 2" HOSES, PROBLEMS W/
BACK PRESSURE ON GRABBER
12:30 - 13:30 1.00| TRP 13 TRIP OUT TO SHOE
13:30 - 15:00 1.50} OTH WORKING ON BACKPRESSURE ON GRABBER, REPLACE CHECK VALVE
15:00 - 18:00 3.00| TRP 1 TRIP OUT , CHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR, CLOSE AND OPEN BLINDS, PIPES
AND HYDRIL

18:00 - 23:00 5.00| TRP 13 TRIP IN TO 1100", HIT BRIDGE, COULD NOT CIRCULATE THROUGH STRING
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32

Date From - To | Hours | Code CSOL:?G Description of Operations

2/9/2007 23:00 - 02:00 3.00| TRP 13 TRIP OUT TO MOTOR,
02:00 - 04:.00 2.00| TRP 13 FLOAT BROKE, CLEAN JUNK OUT OF MOTOR

04:00 - 05:30 1.50{ TRP 2 TRIP IN WITH MOTOR AND IBS, CIRCULATE THROUGH BHA, GOOD
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| TRP 2 TRIP IN WITH BHA
2/10/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| TRP 2 TRIP INTO 1100
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| OTH INSTALL TRIP SLEEVE IN ROTATING HEAD
07:30 - 16:00 8.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 1100’ TO 3183
16:00 - 17:00 1.00/| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER,
17.00 - 18:00 1.00{ REAM |1 HOLE PACKED OFF LOST CIRC, BACK REAM FROM 3207 UP TO 3200' NO
CIRCULATION
18:00 - 22:00 4.00|CIRC 2 LOST CIRC, PACKED OFF, BACK REAM FROM 3207 TO 3179, GOT RETURNS
22:00 - 01:00 3.00| CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD
01:00 - 02:00 1.00( TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 3780
02:00 - 04:00 2.00| REAM (1 WASH AND REAM FROM 3780 TO 3860
04:00 - 05:00 1.00| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, GO THROUGH # 2 PUMP CLEAN OQUT ROCKS
05:00 - 05:30 0.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 3860 TO 3870
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 3870 TO 3875
2/11/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 3875' TO 3927
08:00 - 09:30 1.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP # 2
09:30 - 21:30 12.00 DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 3927' TO 4164’
21:30 - 22:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT TWO SHAKER SCREEN ON ONE ON EACH SHAKER
22:00 - 06:00 8.00| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 4164’ TO 4280, AT 4242' HOLE STARTED TAKING MUD
AVERAGE 65 BBL / HR. ADDED 20 SKS NEW CARB, 20 SKS MICA, 20 SKS
DYNA FIBER, AND 20 SKS ASH PHALT IN 1 HOUR 15MIN LOSSES WERE
DOWN TO 12 BBLS / HOUR
2/12/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00, DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 4292 TO 4326'
09:00 - 05:00 20.00| RIG 2 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION WHILE ATTEMPT TO REPAIRING # 2 MUD PUMP

DISCHARGE, REPAIRS FAILED CHANGED OUT DISCHARGE MODULE
DRILLING FROM 4326' TO 4340

DRILLING FROM 4340' TO 4379

11:00 - 12:00 1.00| SUR DROP SURVEY AT 4309’ 1.5 DEG 61.20 AZI

12:00 - 19:30 7.50| TRP [ TRIP OUT OF HOLE DUE TO PENETRATION RATE

19:30 - 22:00 2.50|OTH PULLED WEAR BUSHING TO CHECK WEAR, DRILL PIPE RIDING ON SIDE OF
BOPS SLIGHT WEAR ON WEAR BUSHING RE RAN WEAR BUSHING

22:00 - 02:30 4.50| TRP 10 MADE UP BIT # 5 SMITH MX9539 AND TRIP IN HOLE ( 1.5 HOURS TO LATCH
ONTO STAND OF 8" DRILL COLLARS )

02:30 - 04:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIPPED AND CUT DRILL LINE

04:00 - 06:00 2.00| OTH ADJUST TOP DRIVE TRACK AND ALINE BOPS WITH ROTARY TABLE
2/14/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00| TRP 0 TRIP IN HOLE TO 4300

09:00 - 10:30 1.60! REAM SAFETY WASH 79' TO BOTTOM 20’ OF FILL

10:30 - 14:30 4.00| DRL DRILLING FROM 4379 TO 4416

14:30 - 15:00 0.50; RIG RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE

05:00 - 06:00 1.00; DRL
2/13/2007 06:00- 11:00 5.00| DRL

I
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DRILLING FROM 4416 TO 4431

RIG REPAIR, REPLACE SUCTION VALVE AND SEAT IN # 1 PUMP

DRILLING FROM 4431 TO 4478

RIG REPAIR # 1 PUMP SUCTION VALVE AND SEAT, BULL WHEEL SIDE, ALSO
CHANGED VALVE IN DISCHARGE MIDDLE

DRILLING FROM 4478 TO 4487

DRILLING/ 4487 TO 4500

CHANGE OUT VALVE, SEAT IN # 2PUMP CENTER POT

RIG SER

DRILL F/ 4500 TO 4520

15:00 - 17.00 2.00| DRL
17.00 - 18:00 1.00| RIG
18:00 - 01:30 7.50| DRL
01:30 - 05:00 3.50| RIG

N =N

05:00 - 06:00 1.00( DRL
2/15/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50/ DRL
10:30 - 13:.00 2.50| RIG
13:00- 13:30 0.50| RIG
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| DRL

a AN = -
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date | From-To | Hours | Code (;S:dbe Description of Operations
2/15/2007 | 14:00 - 15:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRC, MIX , PUMP SWEEP LMC ( LOST 120 BBL. MUD )
15:00 - 18:00 3.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4520 TO 4584
18:00 - 23:00 5.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/4584 TO 4619
23:00 - 00:00 1.00| RIG 2 GO THRU #2 MUD PUMP, CHANGE OUT VALVES ON SUCTION AND
DISCHARGE
00:00 - 03:00 3.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/4619 TO 4641
03:00 - 03:30 0.50| RIG 2 WORK ON #2 PUMP, CHANGE OUT VALVES IN MIDDLE SECTION
03:30 - 06:00 250{DRL |1 DRILL F/4641 TO/
2/16/2007 | 06:00 - 10:00 400|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4671" TO/ 4686' (LOST 100 BBLS MUD, DRAIN VALVE TO TRIP TANK
WAS LEFT OPEN)
10:00 - 13:00 3.00| REAM |1 REAMING, WORK TORQUE OUT
13:00 - 16:00 3.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, MiX & PUMP DRY JOB
16:00 - 18:30 250/ TRP |10 T.0.0.H TO HWDP, SLM 4685'
18:30 - 03:30 9.00| ISP 1 INSPECT BHA & LAY DOWN 4 JTS OF 4 1/2" HWDP
03:30 - 06:00 250[TRP |1 LAY DOWN MOTOR, SHOCK TOOL, IBS STABILIZER, BIT
2/17/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |1 LAY DOWN STABILIZER & MUD MOTOR
07:00 - 08:00 1.00|TRP {1 TRIP IN, PICK UP & REPLACE 4 JTS 4 1/2 HWDP, JARS
08:00 - 12:00 400|TRP |2 TH
12:00 - 14:00 2.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/3254', T/3515'
14:00 - 15:00 100|TRP |2 TH
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/4602 T/ 4685
15:30 - 16:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4685 T/ 4688
16:00 - 16:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CONDITION & CIRC, PUMP SWEEP
16:30- 17:30 100/{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4688' T/ 4701
17:30 - 18:00 050/SUR {1 DEVIATION SURVEY @ 4610' (1.2 DEVIATION)
18:00 - 18:30 050/DRL |1 DRILL F/4701 T/ 4707
18:30 - 19:00 0.50|CIRC {2 LOST CIRCULATION, 100 BBL LOSS
19:00-06:00 | 11.00|CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT SPOT, CIRC & COND MUD, JARING TIGHT HOLE @ 4693', 14FT
OFF BOTTOM
2/18/2007  |06:00 - 14:00 8.00/FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE @ 4693 UP TO 4672
14:00 - 21:30 750{FISH |4 RIG UP WEATHFORD WIRE LINE TRUCK TO FREE POINT
21:30 - 05:00 750(FISH |5 SPOT 300 LBS FRACK SAND IN MUD MOTOR DID NOT WORK SPOTED
300LBS SAND AGAN STILL DID NOT WORK
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE W/ ON STEEL BALL TO LOCK UP MOTOR SO WE
CAN BACK OFF
2/19/2007 | 06:00 - 12:00 6.00|FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE, CAME FREE
12:00 - 13:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT 2 STANDS
13:00 - 14:30 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE, MIX & PUMP PILL, L/D FREE POINT CREW
14:30 - 18:00 350/ TRP |2 T.0.0.H, UD DRILLING JARS
18:00 - 20:00 200|TRP |2 T.0.0H
20:00 - 22:00 200/ TRP 1 L/D SHOCK SUB, MOTOR, PDC BIT, MONEL
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| RIG 1 WORK ON TOP DRIVE
23:00 - 00:00 100 TRP 1 P/U JUNK BASKET, MILL TOOTH BIT
00:00 - 06:00 6.00 TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
2/20/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 1.00{ REAM |1 WASH 90 ' TO BOTTM 4617 TO 4707
07:00 - 07:30 050 FISH |5 WORK JUNK SUB ON BOTTOM PICK UP BALL , NUTS
07:30 - 08:00 050/DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 4707 TO 4718
08:00 - 08:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRC, MIX & PUMP PILL
08:30 - 12:00 350/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE W/ JUNK SUB ( CLOSED BLIND RAMS, WORKED PIPE RAMS )
12:00 - 12:30 0.50/FISH |5 CLEAN OUT JUNK SUB ( RECOVERED 176 STEEL BALL, 76 1/4, 1/2 NUTS )
12:30 - 15:00 250{TRP |1 L/D BIT SUB, P/U MUD MOTOR, MONEL DC.
15:00 - 18:30 350/ TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
18:30 - 19:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM 30' TO BOTTOM, F/4688' T/ 4718'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
2/20/2007  |19:00 - 21:30 250[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4718 T/4780"
21:30 - 22:30 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE SWAB
22:30 - 00:00 150/ DRL |1 DRILL F/4780" T/4812'
00:00 - 01:00 1.00{ RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE ANOTHER SWAB
01:00 - 01:30 0.50(DRL |1 DRILL F/4812 T/4831"
01:30 - 02:00 0.50| RIG 2 COOL #2 MUD PUMP
02:00 - 06:00 400{DRL |1 DRILL F/4831' T/4913'
21212007  |06:00 - 14:30 850/DRL |1 DRILL F/4913" T/5045'
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE 1 DISCHARGE & 2 SUCTION
VALVES
15:00 - 16:30 150/ DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5045' T/5065'
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG
17:00 - 19:00 200/DRL |1 DRILL F/5065' T/5071°
19:00 - 19:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, COOL DOWN #1 MUD PUMP MOTOR
19:30 - 21:00 150/DRL |1 DRILL F/5071' T/ 5078', MW 9.7, 47 VIS,
21:00 - 22:30 1.50{CIRC |1 CIRC & COND MUD, FILL TRIP TANK, MIX & PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY
22:30 - 04:00 550{TRP |10 P.0.0.H, TRIP OUT FOR 8IT
04:00 - 06:00 200|TRP |1 LD & P/U MOTOR & BIT
2/22/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |1 P/U BHA
07:00 - 08:30 1.50{ TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
08:30 - 10:00 1.50| RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE
10:00 - 13:00 300|/TRP {10 TRIP IN HOLE
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH TO 30 'TO BOTTOM ( BLOW BOTTOM OFF GOOD BEFOR DRLG. ) NO
FILL
14:00 - 15:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5078 TO 5165 (HELD BOP DRILL 2 MIN,)
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER. & SER. TOP DRIVE, ( WORK PIPE RAMS )
15:30 - 00:30 9.00|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5165 TO 5258
00:30 - 02:00 1.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON # RIG PUMP, CHANGE
02:00 - 04:00 200/DRL |1 DRILLING F/5258' T/5323
04:00 - 04:30 0.50( RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, 1 SUCTION VALVE ON #2 PUMP
04:30 - 06:00 1.50|DRL |1 DRILLING F/5323 T/5335
2/23/2007 | 06:00 - 10:30 450/DRL 1 DRILLING F/ 5335 TO 5428
10:30 - 12:00 1.50| RIG 2 TURNED FAN AROUND ON # 1 & # 2 PUMPS
12:00 - 13:30 1.50{DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5428 TO 5449
13:30 - 1500 1.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB IN # 2 PUMP MIDDLE POT
15:00-06:00 | 1500/ DRL |1 DRILLI F/ 5449 TO 5570
2/24/2007 | 06:00 - 10:00 400[DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5570 TO 5609
10:00 - 10:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER. , TOP DRIVE SER.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE LINER , SWAB IN # 2 PUMP BILL WHEEL SIDE
11:30 - 16:00 450|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5609 TO 5627
16:00 - 16:30 0.50|CIRC 1 CIRC COND FOR TRIP
16:30 - 17:00 050/ SUR |1 SURVEY @ 5597 .5 DEG 1576 AZ
17:00 - 17:30 0.50/CIRC |1 PUMP PILL, BLOW KELLY OUT
17:30 - 23:00 550/ TRP |10 TRIP OUT FOR BIT # 9 ( HAD TRIP BOP DRILL )
23:00 - 00:00 1.00| TRP 1 CHANGE OUT BITS ( CLOSED BLINDS RAMS, OPEN )
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE
2/25/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00{TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TAGED UP @4785 TITE
07:00 - 12:00 500|CIRC |1 WORK TITE HOLE, LOST 130 BBLS MUD, RUN STAND IN 4813
12:00 - 17:00 5.00( RIG 2 CHANGE PUMP ON TOP DRIVE
17:00 - 17:30 050|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH 60 ' TO BOTTOM
18:00 - 18:00 1.00/DRL {1 DRILL F/5627 TO 5629
19:00 - 20:30 1.50| RIG 2 WORK ON # 1PUMP SWAB, #1 CHAGER PUMP SWITCH DOWN

Printed: 3/6/2007 11:17.23 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R
4-8-S 22-E 26
Rig Name: TRUE

Location:

Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 32

Date | From-To | Hours | Code CS:dbe Description of Operations
225/2007  |20:30-21:00 |  0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5629 TO 5630
21:00-23:00 | 200({RIG |2  |CHANGE SEAT#1 PUMP BULL WHEEL SIDE,CHANGE SWAB MIDDLE
23:00-0200 | 3.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5630 TO 5649
02:00-03:00 | 100|CIRC |2  |LOSTCIRC @ 5649 LOST 300 BELS.
03:00-0430 | 150/TRP |2 |TRIP OUT HOLE TIGHT @ 4810
04:30-06:00 |  1.50| REAM |1 BACK REAMING F/ 48 10 TO 4809
2/26/2007  |06:00-07:00 | 100|CIRC |2  |LOST CIRC ( 150 BBLS)
07:00-09:00 | 200{TRP |2 |TRIP OUT 10 STAND COULDNTT GIRC TRIP TO 4750, BACK REAMING TO 4785
09:00-10:30 | 150|TRP |2 |TRIP BACK IN HOLE
10:30-12:30 |  200/DRL |1 DRILL F/5649 TO 5670
12:30-1330 | 1.00/CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE @ 5670 ON CONN.
13:30-23:00 | 950/DRL |1 DRILLING F/5670 TO 5732
23:00-00:00 | 1.00|CRC |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE @ 5732 TO 5642 ( 3 TIMES HOLE GOOD FREE)
00:00-06:00 |  6.00/DRL |1 DRILLING 5732 TO  ( DRILL W/ NO FLUID LOST)
06:00-
22712007  |06:00-09:00 |  3.00|DRL |1 DRILLING 5780 TO 5804
00:00- 1500 |  6.00| REAM |1 BACK REAM , JARING UP THROW TIGHT HOLE @ 5803 TO 5700
15:00-1530 | 050|RIG |2  |CHANGE OUT GRABBER DIES IN TOP DRIVE
15:30-18:00 | 250{TRP |2 |TRIP OUT HOLE TO 3127 TIGHT
18:00-06:00 |  12.00] REAM |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE F/ 3127 TO 3072 ( 55
2/28/2007  |06:00-09:00 | 3.00[FISH |3  |WORKING TIGHT HOLE JARING UP ( 3272 , 3464 PULLED 1 STD TIGHT AGAIN
3400 JARED OUT TO 3369
09:00-14:00 | 500{TRP |2 |TRIP OUT HOLE
14:00-17:00 | 300|TRP |1 L/D BHA. BIT, MM, JARS, AND STAB
17:00-2200 | 500/ TRP |1 TRIP IN HOLE, TIGHT HOLE AT 3257 WORKED PIPE
22:00-0200 |  4.00/CRC |1 CIRCULATE AND RAISE MUD WEIGHT TO 9.7 AT 3077
02:00-03:00 | 1.00/TRP |1 LOST RETURNS PULLED 2 STANDS
03:00-0530 | 250/ CRC |1 PUMP 2 50 LCM PILL AND CIRC
05:30-06:00 | 0.50|TRP |1 TIH.
31/2007  |06:00-07:30 | 150|TRP |2 |TRIP INHOLE
07:30-08:00 |  0.50| REAM |1 WASHING TO BOTTOM LOST CIRC.
08:00-08:30 | 050/TRP |2 |TRIPOUT 10STD.
08:30-10:00 |  1.50| CRC |1 MIX UP LCM PILL, PUMP
10:00-14:00 | 400|CIRC |2  |CIRC, BUILD MUD VOLUME
14:00-1530 | 150|TRP |2 |TOOH TO 3130 TIGHT HOLE FROM 3250' TO 3130
15:30-19:00 | 350/CIRC |2 |CIRC GOOD RETURNS REAM THROUGH TIGHT SPOT, BUILD VOLUME
19:00-21:00 | 200{TRP |2 |TIHBROKE CIRC EVERY 5 STANDS
21:00-06:00 | 9.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5804' TO 5889
3/2/2007  |06:00-1300 |  7.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5889' TO 5895'
13:00-14:00 |  1.00{CIRC |1 PUMP PILL, CHANGE PLAN GO BACK TO DRILLING
14.00-15:30 |  150/DRL |1 DRILLING NO PROGRESS
15:30-18:00 | 250|DRL |1 MADE AND PUMPED BIT UNBALLING PILL WHILE ATTEMPTING TO DRILL NO
PROGRESS
18:00-00:00 | 6.00|TRP  [10  |TOOH TIGHT HOLE AT 5800 BACK REAMED THROUGH TIGHT SPOT AND
TOOH NO OTHER PROBLEMS
00:00-06:00 | 600 TRP |10  |MUNEW BIT RIH FILLEDPIPE EVERY 6 STANDS AFTER 3200 FOOT
3/32007  [06:00-0700 | 1.00{TRP |10 |TRIP IN HOLE BRAKE CIRC EVERY 5 STAND
07:00-08:00 |  1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM TO 5801'
08:00-1030 | 250|RIG |2 |REPAIR MUD PUMPS # 1 CHANGED OUT SWAB AND SEAT # 2 PUMP
CHANGED OUT SWAB
10:30-11:00 | 050/ REAM |1 WASH REAM FROM 5801' TO 5895°
11:00-11:30 | 050[CIRC |1 PUMP 40 BBLS OF UNBALLING PILL
11:30-12:00 | 050|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 585' TO 5901

Printed: 3/6/2007 11:17:23 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:c?e Description of Operations
3/3/2007 12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR PUMP # 2 CHANGED SWAB
12:30-03:30 | 15.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5901' TO 6014'
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR PUMP #2 CHANGED SWAB
04:00 - 06:00 200[DRL |1 DRILL F/6014' T/ 6041'
3/4/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP # 2 CHANGED SWAB AND VALVE
07:00 - 08:30 150|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6041' TO 6067"
08:30 - 00:30 1.00| REAM |1 TIGHT HOLE WORK PIPE WASHED AND REAMED TIGHT HOLE AT 6000°
09:30 - 13:00 350/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6067" TO 6107°
13:00 - 14:00 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
14:00 - 18:30 450/ TRP |14 SHORT TRIP INTO SHOE, SLM
18:30 - 20:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRLG. LINE
20:00 - 23:30 350/ TRP |14 SHORT TRIP TO BOTTOM
23:30 - 02:00 250|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION, MiX PILL FOR DRY JOB, FILL TRIP TANK
02:00 - 02:30 0.50/SUR |1 DROP SURVEY TOOL, SURVEY @ 6068'
02:30 - 03:00 0.50{ TRP |2 TRIP OUT
03:00 - 04:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR TOP DRIVE HOSE
04:00 - 06:00 200{TRP |2 TRIP OUT
3/5/2007 06:00 - 08:00 200[TRP |2 TOOH, TO RUN 9 5/8 CASING
08:00 - 09:30 1.50| TRP |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE
09:30 - 12:30 300/ TRP |1 LAYED DOWN 6 5/8 HWDP, 8 * DRILL COLLARS MONEL, AND MOTOR
RETRIVED SURVEY DEPTH 6068 DEG. .9 AZ] 149
12:30 - 13:30 1.00{ OTH RETRIVED, WEAR BUSHING
13:30 - 15:00 1.50{CSG |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIGGING UP CASING CREW, FILL UP TOOL, AND
STABING BOARD
15:00-03:00 | 12.00/CSG |2 RUN 140 JTS, 9 5/8 CASING 47#/FT, HCP-110, LT&C
03:00 - 03:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION, LOST CIRCULATION @ 3300, 55 STKS 194GPM,
MW-9.8, VIS 43, 7% LCM
03:30 - 04:30 1.00|CMT |1 R/U HALLIBURTON TO CEMENT, SAFETY MEETING
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| CMT |2 CEMENTING 9 5/8 CASING
3/6/2007 06:00 - 09:30 350/ CMT |2 CEMENTING
LEAD- 842 SK, CBM- LIGHT, 10.5 PPG, YIELD 4.14, F/ 3000° T/5100'
TAIL- 585 SK, 50- 50 POZ, 14.35 PPG, YIELD 1.25, F/5100' T/ 6100'
BUMPED PLUG- @ 9AM 3-5-07, FLOAT HELD @ 3000PS), RELEASED
PRESSURE
09:30 - 10:00 0.50/BOP |1 FINISH N/D BOP AND FLOW LINE
10:00 - 12:00 200/CSG |7 SET SLIPS, CAMERON ROUGH CUT CASING, SET @ 280K
12:00 - 14:00 200(80P |1 4 BOLT BOP TO /D DRILL PIPE
14:00 - 15:00 1.00{CSG |1 L/D & CHANGE OUT ELEVATORS & BAILS
15:00 - 18:00 3.00({TRP |2 TRIP IN TO /D DRILL PIPE, INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
18:00 - 20:00 200{TRP |3 R/U /D MACHINE & LAY DOWN PIPE
20:00 - 21:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
21:30 - 01:30 400|TRP |3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, RIG DOWN L/D TRUCK
01:30 - 06:00 450/BOP |1 N/D BOP

Printed: 3/6/2007 11:17:23 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: ~ 4-8-S 22-E 26 43-047- 348796 Rig Release: 3/7/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code g«;’dbe Description of Operations
1/24/2007  |06:00 - 08:00 200/LOC |4 RIG DOWN TO SKID RiG FOR TRUCKS
08:00 - 10:00 2.00 RIG UP CRAINE, TRUCKS TO PULL FRONT TWO MATS
10:00 - 15:30 550/LOC |4 DIG CELLAR IN STALL RING
15:30 - 17:00 1.50/LOC |4 SLID RIG 10' AHEAD W/ 4 TRUCKS, CRAINE , 2 D-8 CATS
17:00 - 00:00 7.00/LOC |4 RIG BACK UP FRONT YARD
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP |1 PICK UP DP STAND IN DERRICK
1/25/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 400[LOC |4 SET GAS BUSTER, CHOKE HOUSE IN W/ CRAIN, FLOW LINE
10:00 - 12:00 2,00 TRYING TO SCREW IN TO BHA STANDING DERRICK
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 KICK PUMPS IN FROZE IN TOP DRIVE
13:00 - 16:00 3.00 STAND BHA BACK IN DERRICK TOP DRIVE BACK OUT DRILL PIPE IN TOP OF
MONEL DC HAD TO GET SCREWED BACK IN MONEL DC
16:00 - 17:00 100|RIG |5 UNTHAW TOP DRIVE IN UPPER KELLY COCK
17:00 - 18:00 1.00|TRP |1 PICK UP BHA
18:00 - 21:00 3.00[DRL |1 SPUD IN 17 1/2 HOLE @ 1800 1/24/2007 DRILLING F/21 TO 47'
21:00 - 22:00 1.00| RIG 2 TIGHT UP STAND PIPE UNION
22:00 - 02:30 450[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 47 TO 258
02:30 - 05:00 250/ TRP |2 LAY DOWN 6 DP, TO 2 STD 6 5/8 HWD
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH 90' TO BOTTOM
1/26/2007 | 06:00 - 06:30 0.50[SUR |1 SURVEY @ 261 1.2 DEG 54.0 AZ
06:30 - 10:30 400{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 258 TO 350
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 CLEAN OUT SUCTION&DISCHARGE LINE ON CELLAR PUMP
11:00 - 11:30 0.50/DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 350 TO 374
11:30 - 12:30 100|TRP |2 /D 5 JTS. PIPE & RUN IN 6 5/8 HWD
12:30 - 16:30 400[DRL |1 DRILLING F/374 TO 526'
16:30 - 17:00 050[SUR |1 SURVEY @476' 1.7 DEG 39.4 AZ
17:00 - 18:30 150/ TRP {14  |SHORT TRIP TO BIT( SLM BOARD 526.0 STRAP 528.33 NO CORR.)
18:30 - 19:30 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRC. SWEEP AROUND RUN 13 3/8 CSG.
19:30 - 22:00 250/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT RUN 13 3/8 CASING, L/D IBS, SHOCK SUB
22:00 - 00:00 200{CSG |1 RIG UP CASING CREW, CHANGE OUT BAILES ON TOP DRIVE
00:00 - 03:00 300/CSG |2 RUN 12 JTS 13 5/8 CASING K-55 # 54.5 W/ WESTSTATE CASING
03:00 - 04:00 1.00/ CIRC |1 RIG UP CIRC 13 3/8 CSG.
04:00 - 06:00 200/CMT |2 RIG CMT. HELD SAFTY MEETING CMT. 13 3/8 CSG
1/27/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00/CMT |2 CEMENT 13 3/8 CSG. W/ 500 SK. TYP 3 0.2 VERASET, 1% CALCIUM CHLORID,
0.125#/SK POLYFLACK #14.5 PPG.YIELD 1.40 RETRUNED 9.5 BBL TO PIT
FLOAT HELD.PLUG DOWN @ 06:30 RIG DOWN CEMENTER
07:00 - 12:00 500/ WOT |1 woc
12:00 - 18:00 6.00(BOP |1 CUT OFF PIPE, CHIP CMT DOWN 1 FT. FOR BASE PLATE ON HEAD, WELD ON
HEAD, TEST TO 1,000 PSI
18:00-06:00 | 12.00/BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOPS
1/28/2007  |06:00-19:00 | 13.00{BOP |2 TEST BOPS,HAD RETIGHT ALL FLANGE, TESTED HYDRILL WING VAVLES,
UNTHAW HCR VALVE,TESTED HCR
19:00 - 20:00 100/RIG |2 CHANGE OUT 4 1/2 PIPE RAMS, BLOCKS
20:00 - 22:00 200/BOP |2 TEST UPPER KELLY,
22:00 - 00:00 200/RIG |2 FLIP PIPE RAMS OVER
00:00 - 01:00 1.00{BOP |2 CHANGE OUT TEST JT.UNTHAW TOP DRIVE
01:00 - 02:00 1.00/BOP |2 RETEST PIPE RAMS,NO GOOD
02:00 - 06:00 400(RIG |2 NIPPLE DOWN BOPS,WAIT ON NEW DOUBLE GATE FROM QUAIL OUT
CASPER SHOULD BE HEAR @ 12:00 TO DAY
1/20/2007  |06:00-17:00 |  11.00| WOT |4 NIPPE DOWN BOPS , WAIT ON DOUBLE GATE F/ QUAIL IN CASPER,
UNTHAW KELLY HOSE PUT KELLY HOSE EXT.PIPE ON TO KEEP HOSE OFF
TOP DRIVE
17:00 - 23:00 6.00|BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOPS
2300 - 06:00 7.00|BOP |2 TEST BOPS PIPE RAMS, BLINDS, CHOKE MANFOILD, WING VALVE, HCR,

Printed: 4/6/2007 8:21:03 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csol:jbe Description of Operations
1/29/2007  |23:00 - 06:00 7.00|BOP |2 CHECK VALVE UPPER, LOEWR KELLY VAVLE, LOW, 250 PSI 5MINS, HIGH
5,000 10 MIN, HY DRILL 250 LOW 5MIN. HIGH 2500 PSI 10 MINS. TEST
CASING TO 1500 PS! FOR 30 MINS OK
1/30/2007 | 06:00 - 13:30 7.50{ RIG 2 NIPPLE DOWN ROTATING HEAD ADD 14" TO SPOOL WAIT ON WELDER,
REDUE SPOOL FOR ROTATING HEAD,INSTALL WEAR BUSHING, DRILL
MOUSE HOLE,
13:30 - 19:00 5.50| RIG 2 NIPPLE UP ROTATING HEAD, HOOK UP FLOW LINE
19:00 - 20:30 1.50|BOP |1 PUT TRUN BUCKLES ON BOP , CENTER BOP UP TO ROTARY TABLE
20:30 - 00:00 350[TRP |1 P/ UP BHA
00:00 - 01:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TAGED CMT AT 470'
01:00 - 04:30 350/DRL |1 DRILLING CMT ,FLOAT COLLAR, SHOE, & 10" NEW HOLE
04:30 - 05:30 1.00/EQT |2 RIG UP, FIT TEST TO 61 PSI = 10.5 MUD WT BLEAD OFF 10 PSI IN 5MINS
TESTED W/ SINGLE JACK TESTING
05:30 - 06:00 050/ TRP (3 LAY DOWN SLICK JT . DP , UP SPIRAL HWDP
1/31/2007  |06:00 - 09:30 350/DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 526 TO 720
09:30 - 11:00 150{CIRC |1 CIRC WHILE WORKING ON PASON EQUIPT.
11:00 - 12:30 1.50{DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 720 TO 812
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| OTH CIRC. WORK ON TOP DRIVE STALLING OUT W/ 10,000 WT
13:00 - 13:30 0.50|DRL |1 DRILLING F/812 TO 830
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| OTH CIRC. WORK ON TOP DRIVE
14:00 - 15:30 150|{DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 830 TO 904
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER.
16:00 - 17:30 1.50{DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 904 TO 953
17:30 - 20:00 250/ OTH WORK ON TOP DRIVE FILLTER COLAPSED
20:00 - 20:30 050{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 953 TO 1035
20:30 - 21:30 1.00/SUR |1 SURVEY @ 1,000' 1.6 DEG 352 AZ
21:30 - 01:00 350(DRL |1 DRILL F/ 1035 TO 1147
01:00 - 02:30 1.50| OTH CIRCULATE AND WORK PIPE WHILE CHANGE OUT FLITERS ON TOP DRIVE
12 FILTERS ALL IN BAD CONDITION.
02:30 - 06:00 350{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 1147 TO 1250
2/1/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1250' TO 1483'
13:00 - 15:30 2.50| RIG 2 WAITTING ON WELDER AND REPAIR STAND PIPE
15:30 - 17:00 150/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1483 TO 1514
17:00 - 18:00 1.00{SUR |1 RAN WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 1444' 1.9 DEG. 37.30 AZI
18:00 - 20:30 250|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1514' TO 1544'
20:30 - 23:00 250|TRP |13 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CASING SHOE DUE TO MOTOR FAILURE ON TOP
DRIVE
23:00 - 03:00 4.00|RIG 2 CHANGE OUT TOP MOTOR ON TOP DRIVE, AND TESTED MOTOR
03:00 - 04:30 150/ TRP |13 TRIP IN HOLE TO 1079'
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 1079' TO 1544'
2/2/2007 06:00 - 13:00 700{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1544 TO 1734'
13:00 - 15:30 250/ OTH REPAIR PASON
15:30 - 20:30 5.00| RIG 2 WELDER REPAIR DISCHARGE LINE ON PUMP # 2
20:30 - 22:00 150/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1734 TO 1796'
22:00 - 23:00 1.00/CIRC |1 MADE CONNECTION HOLE PACKING OFF BENT TWO JOINTS PIPE
CIRCULATED HI VIS SWEEP
23:00 - 00:30 1.50{DRL  [1 DRILLING FROM 1796' TO 1801'
00:30 - 02:00 1.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP CHANGE SWAB #1 PUMP
02:00 - 06:00 400/DRL {1 DRILLING FROM TO 1801' TO 1920'
2/3/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00|{DRL {1 DRILLING FROM 1900' TO 2017"
11:00 - 11:30 0.50| RIG 1 SERVISE RIGRIG SERVICE
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD
12:00-22:00 | 10.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2017' TO 2203'

Printed: 4/5/2007 8:21:03 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csol:jbe Description of Operations
2/3/2007 22:00 - 22:30 0.50| OTH REPAIR TOP DRIVE
22:30 - 23:00 0.50/SUR |1 WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 2133' 1.7 DEG. 36.2 AZM
23:00 - 06:00 700|{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2203' TO 2275'
2/4/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2275' TO 2309'
08:30 - 09:00 0.50{CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEPS AND CIRCULATE
09:00 - 12:30 350/ TRP |10  |[TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT
12:30 - 14:30 200{TRP |10 CHANGE OUT BIT AND TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE TOP DRIVE
15:00 - 15:30 050/ TRP {10  [TRIP IN HOLE HIT BRIDGE AT 873'
15:30 - 23:00 7.50| REAM {1 WASH AND REAM FROM 873" TO 2164 EXCESSIVE AMOUNTS OF PEE
GRAVEL COMING BACK ACROSS SHALE SHAKERS, RAISING WT AND VIS
23:00 - 00:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT KELLY SAVER SUB
00:00 - 05:00 500/ TRP |10 PACKED OFF WORKING TIGHT HOLE FROM 2164 BACK REAM UP TO
05:00 - 06:00 1.00[CIRC |1 CIRC. AND RAISE WT TO 9.2, VIS TO 40, REAMING TO BOTTOM
2/5/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250 REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 2197 TO 2314
08:30 - 14:00 550 DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2309 TO 2390
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
14:30-06:00 | 1550/ DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2390 TO 2757
06:00 - NOTE: AFTER RAISING VIS AND WT, TORQUE WENT AWAY
2/6/2007 06:00 - 09:30 350/ DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2757 TO 2832
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
10:00 - 12:30 250[DRL {1 DRILLING FROM 2832 TO 2895
12:30 - 13:00 050(RIG |2 RIG REPAIR, FILL # 2 PUMP MOTOR WITH ANTIFREEZE
13:00-06:00 | 17.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2895 TO 3230
2/7/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3230 TO 3275
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR DAY TANK ON # 2 PUMP RAN OUT OF FUEL
07:30 - 10:30 300|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3275 TO 3339
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
11:00-00:30 | 13.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3339 TO 3593
00:30 - 01:30 1.00| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR # 2 PUMP, REPLACED VALVE & SEAT IN SUCTION
01:30 - 06:00 450{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3593 TO 3664
2/8/2007 06:00 - 10:30 450{DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 3664 TO 3750
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT MIDDLE DISCHARGE VALVE AND SEAT # 1 PUMP
11:30 - 17:00 550/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3750 TO 3847
17:00 - 18:00 1.00{ RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
18:00 - 19:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3847 TO 3870
19:00 - 21:00 200|TRP |13 PRESSURE LOSS, BIT QUIT DRILLING, LOOKING FOR PRESSURE LOSS
WENT THROUGH BOTH PUMPS
21:00 - 22:00 1.00|TRP |13 MIX UP PILL
22:00 - 22:30 050/ TRP |13 DROP SURVEY
22:30 - 23:00 050/ TRP |13 PUMP PILL
23:00 - 01:30 250/ TRP |13 |TRIP OUT FOR MOTOR
01:30 - 06:00 450/ TRP |13 |TWO 2" HOSES BLEW INTO BETWEEN TOP DRIVE UNIT AND 1/4 WAY UP
DERRICK, WHILE BREAKING OUT SAVER SUB TO PULL OUT HWDP
06:00 - NOTE: HAD 6 TH MAN CHANGE LINERS IN #1 PUMP TO 5 1/2
2/9/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| OTH WORKING ON TESCO TOP DRIVE, REPLACING 2" HOSES, PROBLEMS W/
BACK PRESSURE ON GRABBER
12:30 - 13:30 1.00|TRP (13 |TRIP OUT TO SHOE
13:30 - 15:00 1.50| OTH WORKING ON BACKPRESSURE ON GRABBER, REPLACE CHECK VALVE
15:00 - 18:00 3.00/TRP |1 TRIP OUT , CHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR, CLOSE AND OPEN BLINDS, PIPES
AND HYDRIL
18:00 - 23:00 500{TRP |13 TRIP IN TO 1100', HIT BRIDGE, COULD NOT CIRCULATE THROUGH STRING
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csc;:?e Description of Operations
2/9/2007 23:00 - 02:00 3.00| TRP {13 TRIP OUT TO MOTOR,
02:00 - 04:00 2.00|TRP {13 FLOAT BROKE, CLEAN JUNK OUT OF MOTOR
04:00 - 05:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP IN WITH MOTOR AND IBS, CIRCULATE THROUGH BHA, GOOD
05:30 - 06:00 050|TRP |2 TRIP IN WITH BHA
2/10/2007  06:00 - 07:00 100/ TRP |2 TRIP INTO 1100
07:00 - 07:30 0.50! OTH INSTALL TRIP SLEEVE IN ROTATING HEAD
07:30 - 16:00 8.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 1100' TO 3183
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER,
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| REAM |1 HOLE PACKED OFF LOST CIRC, BACK REAM FROM 3207 UP TO 3200' NO
CIRCULATION
18:00 - 22:00 4.00/CIRC |2 LOST CIRC, PACKED OFF, BACK REAM FROM 3207 TO 3179, GOT RETURNS
22:00 - 01:00 3.00| CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD
01:00 - 02:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 3780
02:00 - 04:00 2.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 3780 TO 3860
04:00 - 05:00 1.00| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, GO THROUGH # 2 PUMP CLEAN OUT ROCKS
05:00 - 05:30 0.50{ REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 3860 TO 3870
05:30 - 06:00 0.50{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3870 TO 3875
2/11/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 2.00[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3875' TO 3927
08:00 - 09:30 1.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP # 2
09:30-21:30 | 12.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3827 TO 4164'
21:30 - 22:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT TWO SHAKER SCREEN ON ONE ON EACH SHAKER
22:00 - 06:00 8.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4164' TO 4280, AT 4242’ HOLE STARTED TAKING MUD
AVERAGE 65 BBL / HR. ADDED 20 SKS NEW CARB, 20 SKS MICA, 20 SKS
DYNA FIBER, AND 20 SKS ASH PHALT IN 1 HOUR 15MIN LOSSES WERE
DOWN TO 12 BBLS / HOUR
2/12/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4292 TO 4326¢'
09:00-05:00 | 20.00| RIG 2 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION WHILE ATTEMPT TO REPAIRING # 2 MUD PUMP
DISCHARGE, REPAIRS FAILED CHANGED OUT DISCHARGE MODULE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4326' TO 4340'
2/13/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 5.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4340' TO 4379'
11:00 - 12:00 100|/SUR |1 DROP SURVEY AT 430¢' 1.5 DEG 61.20 AZ!
12:00 - 19:30 7.50| TRP  [10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE DUE TO PENETRATION RATE
19:30 - 22:00 2.50| OTH PULLED WEAR BUSHING TO CHECK WEAR, DRILL PIPE RIDING ON SIDE OF
BOPS SLIGHT WEAR ON WEAR BUSHING RE RAN WEAR BUSHING
22:00 - 02:30 450/ TRP |10 MADE UP BIT # 5 SMITH MX9539 AND TRIP IN HOLE ( 1.5 HOURS TO LATCH
ONTO STAND OF 8" DRILL COLLARS )
02:30 - 04:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIPPED AND CUT DRILL LINE
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|OTH ADJUST TOP DRIVE TRACK AND ALINE BOPS WITH ROTARY TABLE
2/14/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00|TRP (10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 4300
09:00 - 10:30 150/ REAM |1 SAFETY WASH 79' TO BOTTOM 20' OF FILL
10:30 - 14:30 400/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4379 TO 4416
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
15:00 - 17:00 200/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4416 TO 4431
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, REPLACE SUCTION VALVE AND SEAT IN # 1 PUMP
18:00 - 01:30 750/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4431 TO 4478
01:30 - 05:00 3.50{ RIG 2 RIG REPAIR # 1 PUMP SUCTION VALVE AND SEAT, BULL WHEEL SIDE, ALSO
CHANGED VALVE IN DISCHARGE MIDDLE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4478 TO 4487
2/15/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 DRILLING/ 4487 TO 4500
10:30 - 13:00 2.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT VALVE, SEAT IN # 2PUMP CENTER POT
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER
13:30 - 14:00 0.50|DRL  [1 DRILL F/ 4500 TO 4520
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code gc:]dbe Description of Operations
2/15/2007 | 14:00 - 15:00 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRC, MIX , PUMP SWEEP LMC ( LOST 120 BBL. MUD )
15:00 - 18:00 300/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4520 TO 4584
18:00 - 23:00 500/DRL |1 DRILL F/4584 TO 4619
23:00 - 00:00 1.00| RIG 2 GO THRU #2 MUD PUMP, CHANGE OUT VALVES ON SUCTION AND
DISCHARGE
00:00 - 03:00 3.00|/DRL |1 DRILL F/4619 TO 4641
03:00 - 03:30 0.50| RIG 2 WORK ON #2 PUMP, CHANGE OUT VALVES IN MIDDLE SECTION
03:30 - 06:00 250/DRL |1 DRILL F/4641 TO/
2/16/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 400/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4671' TO/ 4686’ (LOST 100 BBLS MUD, DRAIN VALVE TO TRIP TANK
WAS LEFT OPEN)
10:00 - 13:00 3.00|REAM |1 REAMING, WORK TORQUE OUT
13:00 - 16:00 3.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, MIX & PUMP DRY JOB
16:00 - 18:30 250/ TRP |10 T.0.0.H TO HWDP, SLM 4685'
18:30 - 03:30 9.00| ISP 1 INSPECT BHA & LAY DOWN 4 JTS OF 4 1/2" HWOP
03:30 - 06:00 250/ TRP |1 LAY DOWN MOTOR, SHOCK TOOL, IBS STABILIZER, BIT
2/17/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 100/ TRP |1 LAY DOWN STABILIZER & MUD MOTOR
07:00 - 08:00 1.00|TRP 11 TRIP IN, PICK UP & REPLACE 4 JTS 4 1/2 HWDP, JARS
08:00 - 12:00 400|TRP |2 TIH
12:00 - 14:00 2,00/ REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/3254', T/3515'
14:00 - 15:00 1.00{TRP |2 TiH
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/4602 T/ 4685
15:30 - 16:00 0.50/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4685 T/ 4688
16:00 - 16:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CONDITION & CIRC, PUMP SWEEP
16:30 - 17:30 1.00|DRL |1 ORILL F/ 4688' T/ 4701
17:30 - 18:00 0.50|SUR |1 DEVIATION SURVEY @ 4610’ (1.2 DEVIATION)
18:00 - 18:30 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/4701 T/ 4707
18:30 - 19:00 0.50|CIRC |2 LOST CIRCULATION, 100 BBL LOSS
19:00-06:00 | 11.00|CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT SPOT, CIRC & COND MUD, JARING TIGHT HOLE @ 4693, 14FT
OFF BOTTOM
2/18/2007  |06:00 - 14:00 800|FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE @ 4693 UP TO 4672
14:00 - 21:30 750/FISH |4 RIG UP WEATHFORD WIRE LINE TRUCK TO FREE POINT
21:30 - 05:00 750/FISH |5 SPOT 300 LBS FRACK SAND IN MUD MOTOR DID NOT WORK SPOTED
300LBS SAND AGAN STILL DID NOT WORK
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE W/ ON STEEL BALL TO LOCK UP MOTOR SO WE
CAN BACK OFF
2/19/2007  |06:00 - 12:00 6.00{FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE, CAME FREE
12:00 - 13:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT 2 STANDS
13:00 - 14:30 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE, MIX & PUMP PILL, L/D FREE POINT CREW
14:30 - 18:00 350/ TRP |2 T.0.0.H, UD DRILLING JARS
18:00 - 20:00 200|TRP |2 TO.0H
20:00 - 22:00 200[TRP 1 L/D SHOCK SUB, MOTOR, PDC BIT, MONEL
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| RIG 1 WORK ON TOP DRIVE
23:00 - 00:00 1.00|TRP |1 P/U JUNK BASKET, MILL TOOTH BIT
00:00 - 06:00 6.00[TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
2/20/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH 90 ' TO BOTTM 4617 TO 4707
07:00 - 07:30 0.50|FISH |5 WORK JUNK SUB ON BOTTOM PICK UP BALL , NUTS
07:30 - 08:00 0.50/DRL |1 ORILLING F/ 4707 TO 4718
08:00 - 08:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRC, MIX & PUMP PILL
08:30 - 12:00 350|TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE W/ JUNK SUB ( CLOSED BLIND RAMS, WORKED PIPE RAMS )
12:00 - 12:30 050(FISH |5 CLEAN OUT JUNK SUB ( RECOVERED 176 STEEL BALL, 76 1/4, 1/2 NUTS )
12:30 - 15:00 250|TRP |1 L/D BIT SUB, P/U MUD MOTOR, MONEL DC.
15:00 - 18:30 350/ TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
18:30 - 19:00 0.50| REAM {1 WASH & REAM 30' TO BOTTOM, F/4688' T/ 4718’

Printed: 4/5/2007 8:21:03 AM



QuestarE & P Page 6 of 9

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code ngdbe Description of Operations
2/20/2007  |19:00 - 21:30 250|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4718' T/4780'
21:30 - 22:30 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE SWAB
22:30 - 00:00 1.50|DRL {1 DRILL F/4780° T/4812'
00:00 - 01:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE ANOTHER SWAB
01:00 - 01:30 0.50[DRL |1 DRILL F/4812' T/4831'
01:30 - 02:00 0.50| RIG 2 COOL #2 MUD PUMP
02:00 - 06:00 400{DRL |1 DRILL F/4831' T/4913'
2/21/2007 | 06:00 - 14:30 850/DRL |1 DRILL F/4913- T/5045'
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE 1 DISCHARGE & 2 SUCTION
VALVES
15:00 - 16:30 150/ DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5045' T/5065'
16:30 - 17:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG
17:00 - 19:00 2.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/5065' T/5071'
19:00 - 19:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, COOL DOWN #1 MUD PUMP MOTOR
19:30 - 21:00 150{DRL |1 DRILL F/5071' T/ 5078, MW 9.7, 47 VIS,
21:00 - 22:30 150{CIRC |1 CIRC & COND MUD, FILL TRIP TANK, MIX & PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY
22:30 - 04:00 550| TRP |10 P.0.0.H, TRIP OUT FOR BIT
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|TRP |1 LD & P/U MOTOR & BIT
2/22/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |1 P/U BHA
07:00 - 08:30 1.50| TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
08:30 - 10:00 1.50| RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE
10:00 - 13:00 3.00|TRP (10 TRIP IN HOLE
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH TO 30 'TO BOTTOM ( BLOW BOTTOM OFF GOOD BEFOR DRLG. ) NO
FILL
14:00 - 15:00 1.00|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5078 TO 5165 (HELD BOP DRILL 2 MIN,)
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER. & SER. TOP DRIVE, { WORK PIPE RAMS )
15:30 - 00:30 9.00{DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5165 TO 5258
00:30 - 02:00 1.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON # RIG PUMP, CHANGE
02:00 - 04:00 200/DRL {1 DRILLING F/5258' T/5323
04:00 - 04:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, 1 SUCTION VALVE ON #2 PUMP
04:30 - 06:00 150/DRL |1 DRILLING F/5323 T/5335
2/23/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5335 TO 5428
10:30 - 12:00 1.50| RIG 2 TURNED FAN AROUND ON # 1 & # 2 PUMPS
12:00 - 13:30 150/DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5428 TO 5449
13:30 - 15:00 1.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB IN # 2 PUMP MIDDLE POT
15:00-06:00 | 15.00|DRL |1 DRILLI F/ 5449 TO 5570
2/24/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 4.00/DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5570 TO 5609
10:00 - 10:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER., TOP DRIVE SER.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00{RIG 2 CHANGE LINER , SWAB IN # 2 PUMP BILL WHEEL SIDE
11:30 - 16:00 450/ DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 56089 TO 5627
16:00 - 16:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRC COND FOR TRIP
16:30 - 17:00 0.50|SUR |1 SURVEY @ 5597 .5 DEG 1576 AZ
17:00 - 17:30 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMP PILL, BLOW KELLY OUT
17:30 - 23:00 550| TRP |10 TRIP OUT FOR BIT # 9 ( HAD TRIP BOP DRILL )
23:00 - 00:00 100|TRP |1 CHANGE OUT BITS ( CLOSED BLINDS RAMS, OPEN )
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE
2/25/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TAGED UP @4785 TITE
07:00 - 12:00 5.00[CIRC |1 WORK TITE HOLE, LOST 130 BBLS MUD, RUN STAND IN 4813
12:00 - 17:00 5.00| RIG 2 CHANGE PUMP ON TOP DRIVE
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH 60 ' TO BOTTOM
18:00 - 19:00 100/DRL |1 DRILL F/5627 TO 5629
19:00 - 20:30 1.50| RIG 2 WORK ON # 1PUMP SWAB, #1 CHAGER PUMP SWITCH DOWN
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 ' Rig Release: 3/7/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
2/25/2007  [20:30 - 21:00 050/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5629 TO 5630
21:00 - 23:00 2.00| RIG 2 CHANGE SEAT #1 PUMP BULL WHEEL SIDE,CHANGE SWAB MIDDLE
23:00 - 02:00 3.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5630 TO 5649
02:00 - 03:00 1.00|CIRC |2 LOST CIRC @ 5649 LOST 300 BBLS.
03:00 - 04:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE TIGHT @ 4810
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| REAM |1 BACK REAMING F/ 48 10 TO 4809
2/26/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00[CIRC |2 LOST CIRC { 150 BBLS)
07:00 - 09:00 200{TRP |2 TRIP OUT 10 STAND COULDN'T CIRC TRIP TO 4750, BACK REAMING TO 4785
09:00 - 10:30 150{TRP |2 TRIP BACK IN HOLE
10:30 - 12:30 200/DRL |1 DRILL F/5649 TO 5670
12:30 - 13:30 1.00|CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE @ 5670 ON CONN.
13:30 - 23:00 950/ DRL |1 DRILLING F/5670 TO 5732
23:00 - 00:00 1.00{CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE @ 5732 TO 5642 ( 3 TIMES HOLE GOOD FREE)
00:00 - 06:00 6.00/DRL |1 DRILLING 5732 TO  ( DRILL W/ NO FLUID LOST)
06:00 -
2/27/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00|DRL |1 DRILLING 5780 TO 5804
09:00 - 15:00 6.00| REAM |1 BACK REAM , JARING UP THROW TIGHT HOLE @ 5803 TO 5700
15:00 - 15:30 050|RIG |2 CHANGE OUT GRABBER DIES IN TOP DRIVE
15:30 - 18:00 250/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE TO 3127 TIGHT
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| REAM |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE F/ 3127 TO 3072 ( 55')
2/28/2007  {06:00 - 09:00 3.00|FISH (3 WORKING TIGHT HOLE JARING UP (3272 , 3464 PULLED 1 STD TIGHT AGAIN
3400 JARED OUT TO 3369
09:00 - 14:00 500{TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE
14:00 - 17:00 300/ TRP |1 L/D BHA. BIT, MM, JARS, AND STAB
17:00 - 22:00 500{TRP |1 TRIP IN HOLE, TIGHT HOLE AT 3257' WORKED PIPE
22:00 - 02:00 4.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND RAISE MUD WEIGHT TO 9.7 AT 3077
02:00 - 03:00 1.00| TRP |1 LOST RETURNS PULLED 2 STANDS
03:00 - 05:30 250|CIRC |1 PUMP 2 50 LCM PILL AND CIRC
05:30 - 06:00 050|TRP |1 TiH.
3/1/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASHING TO BOTTOM LOST CIRC.
08:00 - 08:30 050|TRP |2 TRIP OUT 10 STD.
08:30 - 10:00 1.50|CIRC |1 MIX UP LCM PILL, PUMP
10:00 - 14:00 400[CIRC |2 CIRC, BUILD MUD VOLUME
14:00 - 15:30 150|TRP |2 TOOH TO 3130' TIGHT HOLE FROM 3250' TO 3130'
15:30 - 19:00 350/CIRC |2 CIRC GOOD RETURNS REAM THROUGH TIGHT SPOT, BUILD VOLUME
19:00 - 21:00 200/TRP |2 TIH BROKE CIRC EVERY 5 STANDS
21:00 - 06:00 9.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5804' TO 5889’
31212007 06:00 - 13:00 700{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5889’ TO 5895'
13:00 - 14:00 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP PILL, CHANGE PLAN GO BACK TO DRILLING
14:00 - 15:30 150/DRL |1 DRILLING NO PROGRESS
15:30 - 18:00 250/ DRL |t MADE AND PUMPED BIT UNBALLING PILL WHILE ATTEMPTING TO DRILL NO
PROGRESS
18:00 - 00:00 6.00| TRP |10 TOOH TIGHT HOLE AT 5800' BACK REAMED THROUGH TIGHT SPOT AND
TOOH NO OTHER PROBLEMS
00:00 - 06:00 6.00/TRP |10 M/U NEW BIT RIH FILLEDPIPE EVERY 6 STANDS AFTER 3200 FOOT
3/3/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP {10  |TRIP IN HOLE BRAKE CIRC EVERY 5 STAND
07:00 - 08:00 1.00|REAM |1 WASH AND REAM TO 5801'
08:00 - 10:30 2.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMPS # 1 CHANGED OUT SWAB AND SEAT # 2 PUMP
CHANGED OUT SWAB
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH REAM FROM 5801’ TO 5895'
11:00 - 11:30 050/ CIRC |1 PUMP 40 BBLS OF UNBALLING PILL
11:30 - 12:00 050/ DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5895' TO 501"
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date: ~ 1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSc;Jdbe Description of Operations
3/3/2007 12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR PUMP # 2 CHANGED SWAB
12:30-03:30 |  15.00{ORL |1 DRILLING FROM 5801 TO 6014'
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR PUMP #2 CHANGED SWAB
04:00 - 06:00 2.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/6014' T/ 6041'
3/4/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP # 2 CHANGED SWAB AND VALVE
07:00 - 08:30 150|DRL {1 DRILLING FROM 6041' TO 6067'
08:30 - 09:30 1.00| REAM |1 TIGHT HOLE WORK PIPE WASHED AND REAMED TIGHT HOLE AT 6000°
09:30 - 13:00 3.50/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6067 TO 6107'
13:00 - 14:00 1.00{CIRC [1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
114:00 - 18:30 450 TRP |14 SHORT TRIP INTO SHOE, SLM
118:30 - 20:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRLG. LINE
20:00 - 23:30 350|TRP |14 SHORT TRIP TO BOTTOM
23:30 - 02:00 250[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION, MIX PILL FOR DRY JOB, FILL TRIP TANK
02:00 - 02:30 050[SUR |1 DROP SURVEY TOOL, SURVEY @ 6068’
02:30 - 03:00 0.50{TRP |2 TRIP OUT
03:00 - 04:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR TOP DRIVE HOSE
04:00 - 06:00 2.00{TRP |2 TRIP OUT
3/5/2007 06:00 - 08:00 200/ TRP |2 TOOH, TO RUN 9 5/8 CASING
08:00 - 09:30 150{TRP |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE
09:30 - 12:30 3.00| TRP |1 LAYED DOWN 6 5/8 HWDP, 8 " DRILL COLLARS MONEL, AND MOTOR
RETRIVED SURVEY DEPTH 6068 DEG. .9 AZI 149
12:30 - 13:30 1.00| OTH RETRIVED, WEAR BUSHING
13:30 - 15:00 150{CSG |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIGGING UP CASING CREW, FILL UP TOOL, AND
STABING BOARD
15:00-03:00 | 12.00{CSG |2 RUN 140 JTS, 9 5/8 CASING 47#/FT, HCP-110, LT&C
03:00 - 03:30 050{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION, LOST CIRCULATION @ 3300, 55 STKS 194GPM,
MW-9.8, VIS 43, 7% LCM
03:30 - 04:30 100{CMT |1 R/U HALLIBURTON TO CEMENT, SAFETY MEETING
04:30 - 06:00 150{CMT |2 CEMENTING 9 5/8 CASING
3/6/2007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50|CMT |2 CEMENTING
LEAD- 842 SK, CBM- LIGHT, 10.5 PPG, YIELD 4.14, F/ 3000’ T/5100"
TAIL- 585 SK, 50- 50 POZ, 14.35 PPG, YIELD 1.25, F/5100° T/ 6100’
BUMPED PLUG- @ 9AM 3-5-07, FLOAT HELD @ 3000PS!, RELEASED
PRESSURE
09:30 - 10:00 0.50{BOP |1 FINISH N/D BOP AND FLOW LINE
10:00 - 12:00 2.00/CSG |7 SET SLIPS, CAMERON ROUGH CUT CASING, SET @ 280K
12:00 - 14:00 2.00|BOP |1 4 BOLT BOP TO L/D DRILL PIPE
14:00 - 15:00 1.00{CSG (1 L/D & CHANGE OUT ELEVATORS & BAILS
15:00 - 18:00 3.00[TRP |2 TRIP IN TO L/D DRILL PIPE, INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
18:00 - 20:00 200|TRP |3 R/U L/D MACHINE & LAY DOWN PIPE
20:00 - 21:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
21:30 - 01:30 400|TRP |3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, RIG DOWN L/D TRUCK
01:30 - 06:00 450|BOP |1 N/D BOP
3/7/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00{BOP |1 FINISH NIPPLE DOWN STACK
|o7:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |7 FINISH CLEANING PITS, LAY DOWN TESCO TOP DRIVE, INSTALL B SECTION
& NiTE CAP, LOADING OUT RENTALS
3/8/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 CLEAN TANKS,RIG DOWN & LOAD OUT TOP DRIVE & RENTALS
3/9/2007 07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |4 LOAD OUT RENTALS, INSPECTING DRILL PIPE
3/10/2007  |07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |4 INSPECTING DRILL PIPE 233 JTS.
3/11/2007  |07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |4 PREPARING TO MOVE, FINISH INSPECTING DRILL PIPE 349 JTS. 3 BENT JTS.
3/12/2007  |08:00-18:00 | 10.00|LOC |4 LAY DERRICK DOWN, LOAD OUT 7 TRUCKS
4/1/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |3 ENSIGN 24-RIG DOWN AND MOVE CAMPS TO LOCATION/RIG UP SAME,
HAUL TUBULARS IN, OTHER LOCATION 60% RIGGED DOWN AND 40% OFF
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 32
Date From - To | Hours | Code C:S:dbe Description of Operations
4/1/2007 06:00-18:00 | 1200{LOC |3 LOCATION (BACK YARD IS MOVED OUT)/HARD BANDING BHA/HAVE 4 LOADS
OF TUBULARS STILL ON OLD LOCATION.
18:00- 06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
41212007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 RIG DOWN DERRICK, SUB, MOTOR PACKAGE, 100% RIGGED DOWN AND

100% OFF OLD LOCATION, SET MATTING BOARDS AND BOTTOM SUB, ALL 6"
BHA IS HARD BANDED, (RING GROOVE ON SINGLE GATE HAS STUD
MARKINGS-FLARED OUT)/ MONTORING BACK SIDE-GAINING250 EVERY
HALF HOUR AND BLEEDING IT OFF.

18:00 - 06:00 12.00( OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

4/3/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00{LOC 4 SET IN SUBS, MOTOR PACKAGE, MUD TANKS, PUMPS, HOPPER HOUSE,
PUT DERRICK TOGETHER, LIGHT PLANT, MUD CLEANING EQUIPMENT, BAR
HOPPERS, PREMIX TANK 80% SET IN 25% RIGGED UP, BLEEDING
PRESSURE OFF OF LAST WELL EVERY HALF HOUR UNTIL 1900-LETTING
PRESSURE BUILD WHILE MONITORING.NOT TO EXCEED 5,000 PS}

18:00 - 06:00 12,00 OTH WAIT ON DAY LIGHT/ LETTING WELL BUILD UP PRESSURE

4/4/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00|LOC 4 GET DERRICK READY AND PUT ON FLOOR, PUT COMPOUND TOGHETHER,
SET IN GAS BUSTER LINES/EQUIPMENT, DIESEL TANKS, FIRE LIGHT PLANT,
WELD HOLES IN MUD TANKS (BAD SHAPE), STRING CORDS, HOOKING UP
LINES/PUMP SHED AND BACK YARD. STRING UP DERRICK (LOAED OUT 105
JT'S DRILL PIPE 4" XT 39 TO RIG 236)

18:00 - 06:00 12.00(LOC 4 WAIT ON DAY LIGHT

4/5/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00|LOC 4 BROKE TOUR TODAY, INSPECT DERRICK TO RAISE AND RAISE DERRICK,
RIG UP FLOOR TUGGER AND INSTAL HAND RAILS, UNBRIDLE, LAY DOWN
PART OF TRACK THAT WAS BENT FROM LAST WELL,SET IN YELLOW DOG,
FILL PITS WITH WATER, CHANGING OIL IN MUD PUMP, HOOK UP STAND
PIPE, THERE WAS HANDS STANDING AROUND WATCHING OTHER HANDS
ON A JOB THAT SHOULD ONLY TAKE TWO HANDS TO DO. GOT WITH
PUSHER AND TOLD HIM THAT HE NEED TO SEPARATE HANDS, ONTO
DIFFERENT TASK'S. SO HE STARTED SEPARATING THE HANDS AND
PUTTING THEM ON DIFFERNT TASK'S.

18:00 - 06:00 12.00| LOC 4 RIG UP WET SYSTEM ON BAR HOPPER'S HOOK UP CHOKE LINE, KILL LINE,
CHANGE SWABS LINERS (SHORT TWO BE HERE THIS AM) RIG UP RETURN
LINE ON GAS BUSTER, DRESS SHAKER'S, PUT CULVERT IN FOR MOUSE
HOLE
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN C/g-O 9/?_38 7?0 Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
1/24/2007  106:00 - 08:00 200/LOC |4 RIG DOWN TO SKID RIG FOR TRUCKS
08:00 - 10:00 2.00 RIG UP CRAINE, TRUCKS TO PULL FRONT TWO MATS
10:00 - 15:30 550/LOC |4 DIG CELLAR IN STALL RING
15:30 - 17:00 150{LOC |4 SLID RIG 10' AHEAD W/ 4 TRUCKS, CRAINE , 2 D-8 CATS
17:00 - 00:00 7.00/LOC |4 RIG BACK UP FRONT YARD
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP |1 PICK UP DP STAND IN DERRICK
1/25/2007 | 06:00 - 10:00 400/LOC |4 SET GAS BUSTER, CHOKE HOUSE IN W/ CRAIN, FLOW LINE
10:00 - 12:00 2.00 TRYING TO SCREW IN TO BHA STANDING DERRICK
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 KICK PUMPS IN FROZE IN TOP DRIVE
13:00 - 16:00 3.00 STAND BHA BACK IN DERRICK TOP DRIVE BACK OUT DRILL PIPE IN TOP OF
MONEL DC HAD TO GET SCREWED BACK IN MONEL DC
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| RIG 5 UNTHAW TOP DRIVE IN UPPER KELLY COCK
17:00 - 18:00 100/ TRP {1 PICK UP BHA
18:00 - 21:00 3.00{DRL |1 SPUD IN 17 1/2 HOLE @ 1800 1/24/2007 DRILLING F/21 TO 47'
21:00 - 22:00 1.00| RIG 2 TIGHT UP STAND PIPE UNION
22:00 - 02:30 450/ DRL |1 DRILL F/ 47 TO 258
02:30 - 05:00 250/ TRP |2 LAY DOWN 6 DP, TO 2 STD 6 5/8 HWD
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH 90' TO BOTTOM
1/26/2007  |06:00 - 06:30 0.50[SUR |1 SURVEY @ 261 1.2 DEG 54.0 AZ
06:30 - 10:30 4.00|DRL  [1 DRILL F/ 258 TO 350
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 CLEAN OUT SUCTION&DISCHARGE LINE ON CELLAR PUMP
11:00 - 11:30 050/ DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 350 TO 374
11:30 - 12:30 100|TRP |2 L/D 5 JTS. PIPE & RUN IN 6 5/8 HWD
12:30 - 16:30 400/DRL |1 DRILLING F/374 TO 526'
16:30 - 17:00 050[SUR |1 SURVEY @ 476' 1.7 DEG 394 AZ
17:00 - 18:30 150/ TRP |14 SHORT TRIP TO BIT( SLM BOARD 526.0 STRAP §28.33 NO CORR.)
18:30 - 19:30 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRC. SWEEP AROUND RUN 13 3/8 CSG.
19:30 - 22:00 250/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT RUN 13 3/8 CASING, L/D IBS, SHOCK SUB
22:00 - 00:00 2.00/CSG |1 RIG UP CASING CREW, CHANGE OUT BAILES ON TOP DRIVE
00:00 - 03:00 3.00{CSG |2 RUN 12 JTS 13 5/8 CASING K-55 # 54.5 W/ WESTSTATE CASING
03:00 - 04:00 1.00|CIRC  [1 RIG UP CIRC 13 3/8 CSG.
04:00 - 06:00 200/cMT |2 RIG CMT. HELD SAFTY MEETING CMT. 13 3/8 CSG
112712007 |06:00 - 67:00 1.00|CMT |2 CEMENT 13 3/8 CSG. W/ 500 SK. TYP 3 0.2 VERASET, 1% CALCIUM CHLORID,
0.125#/SK POLYFLACK #14.5 PPG.YIELD 1.40 RETRUNED 9.5 BEL TO PIT
FLOAT HELD.PLUG DOWN @ 06:30 RIG DOWN CEMENTER
07:00 - 12:00 5.00|woT |1 woc
12:00 - 18:00 6.00|BOP |1 CUT OFF PIPE, CHIP CMT DOWN 1 FT. FOR BASE PLATE ON HEAD, WELD ON
HEAD, TEST.TO 1,000 PSt
18:00-06:00 | 12.00(BOP i1 NIPPLE UP BOPS
1/28/2007  |06:00-19:00 | 13.00,BOP |2 TEST BOPS,HAD RETIGHT ALL FLANGE, TESTED HYDRILLWING VAVLES,
UNTHAW HCR VALVE,TESTED HCR
19:00 - 20:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT 4 1/2 PIPE RAMS, BLOCKS
20:00 - 22:00 2.00/BOP |2 TEST UPPER KELLY,
22:00 - 00:00 2.00| RIG 2 FLIP PIPE RAMS OVER
00:00 - 01:00 1.00/{BOP |2 CHANGE OUT TEST JT.UNTHAW TOP DRIVE
01:00 - 02:00 1.00|BOP |2 RETEST PIPE RAMS NO GOOD
02:00 - 06:00 4.00| RIG 2 NIPPLE DOWN BOPS,WAIT ON NEW DOUBLE GATE FROM QUAIL OUT
CASPER SHOULD BE HEAR @ 12:00 TO DAY
1/29/2007  |06:00-17:00 | 11.00| WOT |4 NIPPE DOWN BOPS , WAIT ON DOUBLE GATE F/ QUAIL IN CASPER,
UNTHAW KELLY HOSE,PUT KELLY HOSE EXT.PIPE ON TO KEEP HOSE OFF
TOP DRIVE
17:00 - 23:00 6.00{BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOPS
23:00 - 06:00 7.00/BOP |2 TEST BOPS PIPE RAMS, BLINDS, CHOKE MANFOILD, WING VALVE, HCR,
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code ngldbe Description of Operations
1/29/2007  |23:00 - 06:00 700/BOP |2 CHECK VALVE UPPER, LOEWR KELLY VAVLE, LOW, 250 PSI 5MINS, HIGH
{5,000 10 MIN, HY DRILL 250 LOW 5MIN. HIGH 2500 PSI 10 MINS. TEST
LCASING TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MINS OK
1/30/2007 | 06:00 - 13:30 750|RIG |2 INIPPLE DOWN ROTATING HEAD ADD 14" TO SPOOL WAIT ON WELDER,
{REDUE SPOOL FOR ROTATING HEAD,INSTALL WEAR BUSHING, DRILL
| MOUSE HOLE,
113:30 - 19:00 550/ RIG |2 NIPPLE UP ROTATING HEAD, HOOK UP FLOW LINE
119:00 - 20:30 1.50/BOP |1 PUT TRUN BUCKLES ON BOP , CENTER BOP UP TO ROTARY TABLE
20:30 - 00:00 350{TRP |1 P/ UP BHA
:00:00 - 01:00 1.00| TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TAGED CMT AT 470'
‘;01:00 -04:30 3.50| DRL 1 DRILLING CMT [FLOAT COLLAR, SHOE, & 10' NEW HOLE
104:30 - 05:30 1.00|EQT |2 RIG UP , FIT TEST TO 61 PSI = 10.5 MUD WT BLEAD OFF 10 PSI IN 5MINS
: TESTED W/ SINGLE JACK TESTING
{05:30 - 06:00 050/ TRP |3 LAY DOWN SLICK JT . DP, UP SPIRAL HWDP
1/31/2007  06:00 - 09:30 3.50(DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 526 TO 720
09:30 - 11:00 1.50| CIRC |1 CIRC WHILE WORKING ON PASON EQUIPT.
11:00 - 12:30 150|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 720 TO 812
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| OTH CIRC. WORK ON TOP DRIVE STALLING OUT W/ 10,000 WT
13:00 - 13:30 0.50{DRL |1 DRILLING F/812 TO 830
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| OTH CIRC. WORK ON TOP DRIVE
{14:00 - 15:30 150/DRL {1 DRILLING F/ 830 TO 904
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER.
16:00 - 17:30 1.50|DRL |4 DRILLING F/ 904 TO 953
17:30 - 20:00 2.50| OTH WORK ON TOP DRIVE FILLTER COLAPSED
20:00 - 20:30 0.50/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 953 TO 1035
20:30 - 21:30 1.00|SUR |1 SURVEY @ 1,000 1.6 DEG 352 AZ
21:30 - 01:00 350/ DRL |1 DRILL F/ 1035 TO 1147
01:00 - 02:30 150! OTH CIRCULATE AND WORK PIPE WHILE CHANGE OUT FLITERS ON TOP DRIVE
12 FILTERS ALL IN BAD CONDITION.
02:30 - 06:00 350{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 1147 TO 1250
2/1/2007 06:00 - 13:00 700{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1250' TO 1483’
13:00 - 15:30 250/RIG |2 WAITTING ON WELDER AND REPAIR STAND PIPE
15:30 - 17:00 150/ DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1483' TO 1514’
17:00 - 18:00 1.00|SUR |1 RAN WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 1444' 1.9 DEG. 37.30 AZI
18:00 - 20:30 250/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1514' TO 1544’
20:30 - 23:00 250/TRP |13 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CASING SHOE DUE TO MOTOR FAILURE ON TOP
DRIVE
23:00 - 03:00 400/RIG |2 CHANGE OUT TOP MOTOR ON TOP DRIVE, AND TESTED MOTOR
03:00 - 04:30 1.50| TRP |13 TRIP IN HOLE TO 107¢'
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 1079' TO 1544'
2/2/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00(DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1544' TO 1734'
13:00 - 15:30 2.50| OTH REPAIR PASON
15:30 - 20:30 500|RIG |2 WELDER REPAIR DISCHARGE LINE ON PUMP # 2
20:30 - 22:00 150/ DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1734' TO 1796'
22:00 - 23:00 1.00|CIRC |1 MADE CONNECTION HOLE PACKING OFF BENT TWO JOINTS PIPE
CIRCULATED HI VIS SWEEP
23:00 - 00:30 150{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1796' TO 1801
00:30 - 02:00 150|RIG |2 REPAIR MUD PUMP CHANGE SWAB #1 PUMP
02:00 - 06:00 400|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM TO 1801’ TO 1920'
2/3/2007 06:00 - 11:00 500|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1900’ TO 2017
11:00 - 11:30 0.50| RIG 1 SERVISE RIGRIG SERVICE
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD
12:00-22:00 | 10.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2017' TO 2203'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:(?e Description of Operations
2/3/2007 22:00 - 22:30 0.50| OTH REPAIR TOP DRIVE
22:30 - 23:00 050/SUR |1 WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 2133' 1.7 DEG. 36.2 AZM
23:00 - 06:00 7.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2203’ TO 2275'
2142007 06:00 - 08:30 250/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2275' TO 2309'
08:30 - 09:00 0.50/CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEPS AND CIRCULATE
09:00 - 12:30 350{TRP |10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT
12:30 - 14:30 2.00|TRP |10 CHANGE OUT BIT AND TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE TOP DRIVE
15:00 - 15:30 050/ TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE HIT BRIDGE AT 873'
15:30 - 23:00 7.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 873’ TO 2164 EXCESSIVE AMOUNTS OF PEE
GRAVEL COMING BACK ACROSS SHALE SHAKERS, RAISING WT AND VIS
23:00 - 00:00 1.00{ RIG 2 CHANGE OUT KELLY SAVER SUB
00:00 - 05:00 500/ TRP |10 PACKED OFF WORKING TIGHT HOLE FROM 2164 BACK REAM UP TO
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRC. AND RAISE WT TO 9.2, VIS TO 40, REAMING TO BOTTOM
2/5/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 2197 TO 2314
08:30 - 14:00 550[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2309 TO 2390
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
14:30-06:00 | 1550{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2390 TO 2757
06:00 - NOTE: AFTER RAISING VIS AND WT, TORQUE WENT AWAY
2/6/2007 06:00 - 09:30 350/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2757 TO 2832
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
10:00 - 12:30 250/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2832 TO 2895
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, FILL # 2 PUMP MOTOR WITH ANTIFREEZE
13:00-06:00 | 17.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2895 TO 3230
21712007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3230 TO 3275
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR DAY TANK ON # 2 PUMP RAN OUT OF FUEL
07:30 - 10:30 3.00/DRL {1 DRILLING FROM 3275 TO 3339
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
11:00-00:30 | 13.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3338 TO 3593
00:30 - 01:30 1.00| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR # 2 PUMP, REPLACED VALVE & SEAT IN SUCTION
01:30 - 06:00 450/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3593 TO 3664
2/8/2007 06:00 - 10:30 450 DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3664 TO 3750
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT MIDDLE DISCHARGE VALVE AND SEAT # 1 PUMP
11:30 - 17:00 550/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3750 TO 3847
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
18:00 - 19:00 100|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3847 TO 3870
19:00 - 21:00 200/ TRP |13 PRESSURE LOSS, BIT QUIT DRILLING, LOOKING FOR PRESSURE LOSS
WENT THROUGH BOTH PUMPS
21:00 - 22:00 1.00| TRP |13 MIX UP PILL
22:00 - 22:30 0.50| TRP |13 DROP SURVEY
22:30 - 23:00 0.50| TRP  [13 PUMP PILL
23:00 - 01:30 250/ TRP |13 TRIP OUT FOR MOTOR
01:30 - 06:00 450/ TRP |13 TWO 2" HOSES BLEW INTO BETWEEN TOP DRIVE UNIT AND 1/4 WAY UP
DERRICK, WHILE BREAKING OUT SAVER SUB TO PULL QUT HWDP
06:00 - NOTE: HAD 6 TH MAN CHANGE LINERS IN #1 PUMP TO 5 1/2
21912007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50/ OTH WORKING ON TESCO TOP DRIVE, REPLACING 2" HOSES, PROBLEMS W/
BACK PRESSURE ON GRABBER
12:30 - 13:30 1.00{TRP |13 TRIP OUT TO SHOE
13:30 - 15:00 1.50| OTH WORKING ON BACKPRESSURE ON GRABBER, REPLACE CHECK VALVE
15:00 - 18:00 300|{TRP |1 TRIP OUT , CHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR, CLOSE AND OPEN BLINDS, PIPES
AND HYDRIL
18:00 - 23:00 5.00{TRP |13 TRIP IN TO 1100', HIT BRIDGE, COULD NOT CIRCULATE THROUGH STRING
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cst;jdbe Description of Operations
2/9/2007 23:00 - 02:00 3.00|TRP |13 TRIP OUT TO MOTOR,
02:00 - 04:00 200|TRP |13 FLOAT BROKE, CLEAN JUNK OUT OF MOTOR
04:00 - 05:30 150/ TRP |2 TRIP IN WITH MOTOR AND IBS, CIRCULATE THROUGH BHA, GOOD
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| TRP |2 TRIP IN WITH BHA
2/10/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP INTO 1100
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| OTH INSTALL TRIP SLEEVE IN ROTATING HEAD
07:30 - 16:00 8.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 1100° TO 3183
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER,
17:00 - 18:00 1.00{ REAM |1 HOLE PACKED OFF LOST CIRC, BACK REAM FROM 3207 UP TO 3200' NO
CIRCULATION
18:00 - 22:00 400|CIRC |2 LOST CIRC, PACKED OFF, BACK REAM FROM 3207 TO 3179, GOT RETURNS
22:00 - 01:00 3.00[CIRC {1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD
01:00 - 02:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 3780
02:00 - 04:00 2.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 3780 TO 3860
04:00 - 05:00 1.00( RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, GO THROUGH # 2 PUMP CLEAN OUT ROCKS
05:00 - 05:30 0.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 3860 TO 3870
05:30 - 06:00 050{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3870 TO 3875
2/11/2007  06:00 - 08:00 200{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3875' TO 3927'
08:00 - 09:30 1.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP # 2
09:30-21:30 | 1200{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3827' TO 4164'
21:30 - 22:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT TWO SHAKER SCREEN ON ONE ON EACH SHAKER
22:00 - 06:00 800(DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4164’ TO 4280, AT 4242' HOLE STARTED TAKING MUD
AVERAGE 66 BBL / HR. ADDED 20 SKS NEW CARB, 20 SKS MICA, 20 SKS
DYNA FIBER, AND 20 SKS ASH PHALT IN 1 HOUR 15MIN LOSSES WERE
DOWN TO 12 BBLS / HOUR
2/12/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4292' TO 4326'
09:00-05:00 |  20.00|RIG 2 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION WHILE ATTEMPT TO REPAIRING # 2 MUD PUMP
DISCHARGE, REPAIRS FAILED CHANGED OUT DISCHARGE MODULE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4326' TO 4340"
2/13/2007 | 06:00 - 11:00 5.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4340’ TO 4379'
11:00 - 12:00 1.00|SUR |1 DROP SURVEY AT 4309' 1.5 DEG 61.20 AZI
12:00 - 19:30 750|TRP (10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE DUE TO PENETRATION RATE
19:30 - 22:00 2.50| OTH PULLED WEAR BUSHING TO CHECK WEAR, DRILL PIPE RIDING ON SIDE OF
BOPS SLIGHT WEAR ON WEAR BUSHING RE RAN WEAR BUSHING
22:00 - 02:30 450|TRP |10 MADE UP BIT # 5 SMITH MX9539 AND TRIP IN HOLE ( 1.5 HOURS TO LATCH
ONTO STAND OF 8" DRILL COLLARS )
02:30 - 04:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIPPED AND CUT DRILL LINE
04:00 - 06:00 2.00| OTH ADJUST TOP DRIVE TRACK AND ALINE BOPS WITH ROTARY TABLE
2/14/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00{TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 4300
09:00 - 10:30 150/ REAM |1 SAFETY WASH 79" TO BOTTOM 20’ OF FILL
10:30 - 14:30 400/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4379 TO 4416
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
15:00 - 17:00 200|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4416 TO 4431
17:00 - 18:00 1.00} RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, REPLACE SUCTION VALVE AND SEAT IN # 1 PUMP
18:00 - 01:30 7.50/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4431 TO 4478
01:30 - 05:00 3.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR # 1 PUMP SUCTION VALVE AND SEAT, BULL WHEEL SIDE, ALSO
CHANGED VALVE IN DISCHARGE MIDDLE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4478 TO 4487
2/15/2007 | 06:00 - 10:30 450[DRL |1 DRILLING/ 4487 TO 4500
10:30 - 13:00 2.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT VALVE, SEAT IN # 2PUMP CENTER POT
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER
13:30 - 14:00 0.50/ DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4500 TO 4520

Printed: 5/2/2007 9:14:30 AM




QuestarE & P Page 5 of 15

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code ng’é)e Description of Operations
2/15/2007  [14:00 - 15:00 1.00[CIRC |1 CIRC, MIX , PUMP SWEEP LMC ( LOST 120 BBL. MUD )
15:00 - 18:00 3.00(DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4520 TO 4584
18:00 - 23:00 500{DRL |1 DRILL F/4584 TO 4619
23:00 - 00:00 1.00{ RIG 2 GO THRU #2 MUD PUMP, CHANGE OUT VALVES ON SUCTION AND
DISCHARGE
00:00 - 03:00 3.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/4619 TO 4641
03:00 - 03:30 0.50| RIG 2 WORK ON #2 PUMP, CHANGE OUT VALVES IN MIDDLE SECTION
03:30 - 06:00 250/DRL |1 DRILL F/4641 TO/
2/16/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 400{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4671 TO/ 4686' (LOST 100 BBLS MUD, DRAIN VALVE TO TRIP TANK
WAS LEFT OPEN)
10:00 - 13:00 3.00| REAM |1 REAMING, WORK TORQUE OUT
13:00 - 16:00 3.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, MiX & PUMP DRY JOB
16:00 - 18:30 250{TRP |10 T.0.0.H TO HWDP, SLM 4685'
18:30 - 03:30 9.00| ISP 1 INSPECT BHA & LAY DOWN 4 JTS OF 4 1/2" HWDP
03:30 - 06:00 250 TRP |1 LAY DOWN MOTOR, SHOCK TOOL, IBS STABILIZER, BIT
2/17/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00| TRP 1 LAY DOWN STABILIZER & MUD MOTOR
07:00 - 08:00 1.00| TRP |1 TRIP IN, PICK UP & REPLACE 4 JTS 4 1/2 HWDP, JARS
08:00 - 12:00 400|TRP |2 TiH
12:00 - 14:00 2.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/3254', T/3515'
14:00 - 15:00 1.00|TRP |2 TH
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/4602 T/ 4685
15:30 - 16:00 0.50/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4685 T/ 4688
16:00 - 16:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CONDITION & CIRC, PUMP SWEEP
16:30 - 17:30 1.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4688 T/ 4701
17:30 - 18:00 050/ SUR |1 DEVIATION SURVEY @ 4610’ (1.2 DEVIATION)
18:00 - 18:30 0.50/DRL |1 DRILL F/4701 T/ 4707
18:30 - 19:00 0.50|CIRC |2 LOST CIRCULATION, 100 BBL LOSS
19:00-06:00 | 11.00|CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT SPOT, CIRC & COND MUD, JARING TIGHT HOLE @ 4693', 14FT
OFF BOTTOM
2/18/2007 | 06:00 - 14:00 800|FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE @ 4693 UP TO 4672
14:00 - 21:30 7.50|FISH |4 RIG UP WEATHFORD WIRE LINE TRUCK TO FREE POINT
21:30 - 05:00 7.50/FISH |5 SPOT 300 LBS FRACK SAND IN MUD MOTOR DID NOT WORK SPOTED
300LBS SAND AGAN STILL DID NOT WORK
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE W/ ON STEEL BALL TO LOCK UP MOTOR SO WE
CAN BACK OFF
2/19/2007  |06:00 - 12:00 6.00/FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE, CAME FREE
12:00 - 13:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT 2 STANDS
13:00 - 14:30 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE, MiX & PUMP PILL, L/D FREE POINT CREW
14:30 - 18:00 350/ TRP |2 T.0.0.H, /D DRILLING JARS
18:00 - 20:00 200|TRP |2 T.O.0H
20:00 - 22:00 200/ TRP |1 L/D SHOCK SUB, MOTOR, PDC BIT, MONEL
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| RIG 1 WORK ON TOP DRIVE
23:00 - 00:00 1.00|TRP |1 P/U JUNK BASKET, MILL TOOTH BIT
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
2/20/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH 90’ TO BOTTM 4617 TO 4707
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 FISH {5 WORK JUNK SUB ON BOTTOM PICK UP BALL , NUTS
07:30 - 08:00 050[DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 4707 TO 4718
08:00 - 08:30 0.50/CIRC |1 CIRC, MIX & PUMP PILL
08:30 - 12:00 350/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE W/ JUNK SUB ( CLOSED BLIND RAMS, WORKED PIPE RAMS )
12:00 - 12:30 0.50|FISH |5 CLEAN OUT JUNK SUB ( RECOVERED 176 STEEL BALL, 76 1/4, 1/2 NUTS))
12:30 - 15:00 250/ TRP |1 LD BIT SUB, P/U MUD MOTOR, MONEL DC.
15:00 - 18:30 350/ TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
18:30 - 19:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM 30' TO BOTTOM, F/4688' T/ 4718’
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csc;‘dbe Description of Operations
2/20/2007 | 19:00 - 21:30 250|DRL 1 DRILL F/ 4718 T/4780'
21:30-22:30 | 1.00|RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE SWAB
22:30 - 00:00 150/ DRL |1 DRILL F/4780" T/4812'
00:00 - 01:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE ANOTHER SWAB
01:00 - 01:30 0.50|DRL 1 DRILL F/4812 T/4831'
01:30 - 02:00 0.50| RIG 2 COOL #2 MUD PUMP
02:00 - 06:00 400{DRL |1 DRILL F/4831' T/4913'
2/2412007  |06:00 - 14:30 8.50|DRL {1 DRILL F/4913'- T/5045'
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE 1 DISCHARGE & 2 SUCTION
VALVES
15:00 - 16:30 150{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5045' T/5065'
16:30 - 17:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG
17:00 - 19:00 200/DRL |1 DRILL F/5065' T/5071'
19:00 - 19:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, COOL DOWN #1 MUD PUMP MOTOR
19:30 - 21:00 150|DRL |1 DRILL F/5071' T/ 5078, MW 9.7, 47 VIS,
21:00 - 22:30 150/ CIRC |1 CIRC & COND MUD, FILL TRIP TANK, MIX & PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY
22:30 - 04:00 550/ TRP 10  !P.O.O.H, TRIP OUT FOR BIT
04:00 - 06:00 2.00{TRP |1 LD & P/U MOTOR & BIT
2/22/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 100|TRP |1 P/U BHA
07:00 - 08:30 150/ TRP {10 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
08:30 - 10:00 1.50| RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE
10:00 - 13:00 3.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH TO 30 'TO BOTTOM ( BLOW BOTTOM OFF GOOD BEFOR DRLG. ) NO
FILL
14:00 - 15:00 100{DRL {1 DRILLING F/ 5078 TO 5165 (HELD BOP DRILL 2 MIN,)
15:00 - 15:30 0.50] RIG 1 RIG SER. & SER. TOP DRIVE, { WORK PIPE RAMS )
15:30 - 00:30 9.00/ DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5165 TO 5258
00:30 - 02:00 1.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON # RIG PUMP, CHANGE
02:00 - 04:00 2.00|DRL {1 DRILLING F/5258' T/5323
04:00 - 04:30 0.50{ RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, 1 SUCTION VALVE ON #2 PUMP
04:30 - 06:00 150/DRL |1 DRILLING F/5323' T/5335
2/23/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450{DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5335 TO 5428
10:30 - 12:00 1.50{ RIG 2 TURNED FAN AROUND ON # 1 & # 2 PUMPS
12:00 - 13:30 150|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5428 TO 5449
13:30 - 15:00 1.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB IN # 2 PUMP MIDDLE POT
15:00-06:00 | 15.00|DRL |1 DRILL! F/ 5449 TO 5570
2/24/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 400|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5570 TO 5609
10:00 - 10:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER. , TOP DRIVE SER.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE LINER , SWAB IN # 2 PUMP BILL WHEEL SIDE
11:30 - 16:00 450{DRL  [1 DRILLING F/ 5609 TO 5627
16:00 - 16:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRC COND FOR TRIP
16:30 - 17:00 050/ SUR |1 SURVEY @ 5597 .5 DEG 1576 AZ
17:00 - 17:30 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMP PILL, BLOW KELLY OUT
17:30 - 23:00 550/ TRP |10 TRIP OUT FOR BIT # 9 ( HAD TRIP BOP DRILL )
23:00 - 00:00 1.00|TRP |1 CHANGE OUT BITS ( CLOSED BLINDS RAMS, OPEN )
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP  [10 TRIP IN HOLE
2/25/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TAGED UP @4785 TITE
07:00 - 12:00 5.00|CIRC |1 WORK TITE HOLE, LOST 130 BBLS MUD, RUN STAND IN 4813
12:00 - 17:00 5.00| RIG 2 CHANGE PUMP ON TOP DRIVE
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH 60 ' TO BOTTOM
18:00 - 19:00 100{DRL 1 DRILL F/5627 TO 5629
19:00 - 20:30 1.50{ RIG 2 WORK ON # 1PUMP SWAB, #1 CHAGER PUMP SWITCH DOWN
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Sub g .
Date From - To | Hours | Code Code Description of Operations
2/25/2007  |20:30 - 21:00 0.50|DRL {1 DRILL F/ 5629 TO 5630
21:00 - 23:00 2.00| RIG 2 CHANGE SEAT #1 PUMP BULL WHEEL SIDE,CHANGE SWAB MIDDLE
23:00 - 02:00 3.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5630 TO 5649
02:00 - 03:00 1.00|CIRC |2 LOST CIRC @ 5649 LOST 300 BBLS.
03:00 - 04:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE TIGHT @ 4810
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| REAM |1 BACK REAMING F/ 48 10 TO 4809
2/26/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|CIRC |2 LOST CIRC ( 150 BBLS)
07:00 - 09:00 2.00{TRP |2 TRIP OUT 10 STAND COULDN'T CIRC TRIP TO 4750, BACK REAMING TO 4785
09:00 - 10:30 150{TRP |2 TRIP BACK IN HOLE
10:30 - 12:30 2.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/5649 TO 5670
12:30 - 13:30 1.00|CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE @ 5670 ON CONN.
13:30 - 23:00 950/DRL |1 DRILLING F/5670 TO 5732
23:00 - 00:00 1.00/CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE @ 5732 TO 5642 ( 3 TIMES HOLE GOOD FREE)
00:00 - 06:00 6.00|DRL |1 DRILLING 5732 TO  ( DRILL W/ NO FLUID LOST)
06:00 -
2/27/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00{DRL |1 DRILLING 5780 TO 5804
09:00 - 15:00 6.00| REAM |1 BACK REAM , JARING UP THROW TIGHT HOLE @ 5803 TO 5700
15:00 - 15:30 0.50|RIG 2 CHANGE OUT GRABBER DIES IN TOP DRIVE
15:30 - 18:00 250{TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE TO 3127 TIGHT
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| REAM |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE F/ 3127 TO 3072 ( 55"
2/28/2007  {06:00 - 09:00 3.00|FISH |3 WORKING TIGHT HOLE JARING UP ( 3272 , 3464 PULLED 1 STD TIGHT AGAIN
3400 JARED OUT TO 3369
09:00 - 14:00 500/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE
14:00 - 17:00 3.00/TRP |1 L/D BHA. BIT, MM, JARS, AND STAB
17:00 - 22:00 500/ TRP {1 TRIP IN HOLE, TIGHT HOLE AT 3257' WORKED PIPE
22:00 - 02:00 400/CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND RAISE MUD WEIGHT TO 9.7 AT 3077’
02:00 - 03:00 1.00,TRP |1 LOST RETURNS PULLED 2 STANDS
03:00 - 05:30 250|CIRC |1 PUMP 2 50 LCM PILL AND CIRC
05:30 - 06:00 050|TRP |1 TIH.
3/1/2007 06:00 - 07:30 150/ TRP 12 TRIP IN HOLE
07:30 - 08:00 0.50 REAM |1 WASHING TO BOTTOM LOST CIRC.
08:00 - 08:30 050/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT 10 STD.
08:30 - 10:00 1.50|CIRC |1 MIX UP LCM PILL, PUMP
10:00 - 14:00 400[CIRC |2 CIRC, BUILD MUD VOLUME
14:00 - 15:30 150|TRP |2 TOOH TO 3130' TIGHT HOLE FROM 3250' TO 3130'
15:30 - 19:00 3.50|CIRC |2 CIRC GOOD RETURNS REAM THROUGH TIGHT SPOT, BUILD VOLUME
19:00 - 21:00 200|TRP |2 TiH BROKE CIRC EVERY 5 STANDS
21:00 - 06:00 9.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5804' TO 5889'
3/2/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5889' TO 5895'
13:00 - 14:00 1.00{CIRC |1 PUMP PILL, CHANGE PLAN GO BACK TO DRILLING
14:00 - 15:30 1.50{DRL |1 DRILLING NO PROGRESS
15:30 - 18:00 250/DRL |1 MADE AND PUMPED BIT UNBALLING PILL WHILE ATTEMPTING TO DRILL NO
; PROGRESS
£18:00 - 00:00 6.00| TRP |10 TOOH TIGHT HOLE AT 5800' BACK REAMED THROUGH TIGHT SPOT AND
TOOH NO OTHER PROBLEMS
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP |10 M/U NEW BIT RIH FILLEDPIPE EVERY 6 STANDS AFTER 3200 FOOT
3/3/2007 06:00 - 07:00 100/ TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE BRAKE CIRC EVERY 5 STAND
07:00 - 08:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM TO 5801
08:00 - 10:30 2.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMPS # 1 CHANGED OUT SWAB AND SEAT # 2 PUMP
CHANGED OUT SWAB
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 REAM |1 WASH REAM FROM 5801 TO 5895’
11:00 - 11:30 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMP 40 BBLS OF UNBALLING PILL
11:30 - 12:00 050{DRL {1 DRILLING FROM 5895' TO 5901
|
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code gé’dbe Description of Operations
3/3/2007 12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR PUMP # 2 CHANGED SWAB
12:30-03:30 | 15.00|DRL  [1 DRILLING FROM 5901' TO 6014’
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR PUMP #2 CHANGED SWAB
04:00 - 06:00 200/DRL |1 DRILL F/6014' T/ 6041'
3/4/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP # 2 CHANGED SWAB AND VALVE
07:00 - 08:30 1.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6041' TO 6067
08:30 - 09:30 1.00| REAM |1 TIGHT HOLE WORK PIPE WASHED AND REAMED TIGHT HOLE AT 6000"
09:30 - 13:00 350{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6067' TO 6107"
13:00 - 14:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
14:00 - 18:30 450/ TRP |14 SHORT TRIP INTO SHOE, SLM
18:30 - 20:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRLG. LINE
20:00 - 23:30 350/ TRP |14 SHORT TRIP TO BOTTOM
23:30 - 02:00 250[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION, MIX PILL FOR DRY JOB, FILL TRIP TANK
02:00 - 02:30 0.50[SUR |1 DROP SURVEY TOOL, SURVEY @ 6068’
02:30 - 03:00 050/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT
03:00 - 04:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR TOP DRIVE HOSE
04:00 - 06:00 200/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT
3/5/2007 06:00 - 08:00 200/ TRP |2 TOOH, TO RUN 9 5/8 CASING
08:00 - 09:30 150|TRP |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE
09:30 - 12:30 3.00|TRP |1 LAYED DOWN 6 5/8 HWDP, 8 " DRILL COLLARS MONEL, AND MOTOR
RETRIVED SURVEY DEPTH 6068 DEG. .9 AZI 149
12:30 - 13:30 1.00| OTH RETRIVED, WEAR BUSHING
13:30 - 15:00 1.50/CSG |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIGGING UP CASING CREW, FILL UP TOOL, AND
STABING BOARD
15:00-03:00 | 12.00|{CSG |2 RUN 140 JTS, 9 5/8 CASING 47#/FT, HCP-110, LT&C
03:00 - 03:30 0.50{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION, LOST CIRCULATION @ 3300', 55 STKS 194GPM,
MW-9.8, VIS 43, 7% LCM
03:30 - 04:30 1.00{CMT |1 R/U HALLIBURTON TO CEMENT, SAFETY MEETING
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| CMT |2 CEMENTING 9 5/8 CASING
3/6/2007 06:00 - 09:30 350/ CMT |2 CEMENTING
LEAD- 842 SK, CBM- LIGHT, 10.5 PPG, YIELD 4.14, F/ 3000" 7/5100"
TAIL- 585 SK, 50- 50 POZ, 14.35 PPG, YIELD 1.25, F/5100° T/ 6100’
BUMPED PLUG- @ 9AM 3-5-07, FLOAT HELD @ 3000PS|, RELEASED
PRESSURE
09:30 - 10:00 0.50|BOP |1 FINISH N/D BOP AND FLOW LINE
10:00 - 12:00 200(csG |7 SET SLIPS, CAMERON ROUGH CUT CASING, SET @ 280K
12:00 - 14:00 2.00/BOP |1 4 BOLT BOP TO L/D DRILL PIPE
14:00 - 15:00 1.00/CSG |1 /D & CHANGE OUT ELEVATORS & BAILS
15:00 - 18:00 300/ TRP |2 TRIP IN TO L/D DRILL PIPE, INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
18:00 - 20:00 2.00{TRP |3 R/U L/D MACHINE & LAY DOWN PIPE
20:00 - 21:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
21:30 - 01:30 400|TRP |3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, RIG DOWN LD TRUCK
01:30 - 06:00 450/BOP |1 N/D BOP
3/7/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00{BOP |1 FINISH NIPPLE DOWN STACK
07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |7 FINISH CLEANING PITS, LAY DOWN TESCO TOP DRIVE, INSTALL 8 SECTION
& NITE CAP, LOADING OUT RENTALS
3/8/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00[LOC |4 CLEAN TANKS,RIG DOWN & LOAD OUT TOP DRIVE & RENTALS
3/9/2007 07:00-18:00 | 11.00/LOC |4 LOAD OUT RENTALS, INSPECTING DRILL PIPE
3/10/2007  |07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |4 INSPECTING DRILL PIPE 233 JTS.
3/11/2007  |07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |4 PREPARING TO MOVE, FINISH INSPECTING DRILL PIPE 349 JTS. 3 BENT JTS.
3/12/2007  |08:00-18:00 | 10.00|{LOC |4 LAY DERRICK DOWN, LOAD OUT 7 TRUCKS
4/1/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |3 ENSIGN 24-RIG DOWN AND MOVE CAMPS TO LOCATION/RIG UP SAME,
HAUL TUBULARS IN, OTHER LOCATION 60% RIGGED DOWN AND 40% OFF
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Operations Summary Report

Welil Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R
4-8-S 22-E 26

Location:
Rig Name:

ENSIGN

Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Rig Release:
Rig Number: 24

Date

From-To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

4/1/2007

4/2/2007

4/3/2007

4/4/2007

4/5/2007

4/6/2007

4/7/2007

06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00
06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00
06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00
06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00
06:00 - 18:00

:18:00 - 06:00

06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00

06:00 - 09:00

09:00 - 06:00

12.00

12.00
12.00

12.00
12.00

12.00
12.00

12.00
12.00

12.00

12.00

12.00

3.00

21.00

LOC

OTH
LoC

OTH
LoC

OTH
LoC

Loc
LOoC

LOC

LoC

LOC

LOC

OTH

N

LOCATION (BACK YARD IS MOVED OUTYHARD BANDING BHA/HAVE 4 LOADS
OF TUBULARS STILL ON OLD LOCATION.

WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

RIG DOWN DERRICK, SUB, MOTOR PACKAGE, 100% RIGGED DOWN AND
100% OFF OLD LOCATION, SET MATTING BOARDS AND BOTTOM SUB, ALL 6"
BHA IS HARD BANDED, (RING GROOVE ON SINGLE GATE HAS STUD
MARKINGS-FLARED OUT), MONTORING BACK SIDE-GAINING250 EVERY
HALF HOUR AND BLEEDING T OFF.

WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

SET IN SUBS, MOTOR PACKAGE, MUD TANKS, PUMPS, HOPPER HOUSE,
PUT DERRICK TOGETHER, LIGHT PLANT, MUD CLEANING EQUIPMENT, BAR
HOPPERS, PREMIX TANK 80% SET IN 25% RIGGED UP, BLEEDING
PRESSURE OFF OF LAST WELL EVERY HALF HOUR UNTIL 1900-LETTING
PRESSURE BUILD WHILE MONITORING.NOT TO EXCEED 5,000 PS!

WAIT ON DAY LIGHT/ LETTING WELL BULD UP PRESSURE

GET DERRICK READY AND PUT ON FLOOR, PUT COMPOUND TOGHETHER,
SET IN GAS BUSTER LINES/EQUIPMENT, DIESEL TANKS, FIRE LIGHT PLANT,
WELD HOLES IN MUD TANKS (BAD SHAPE), STRING CORDS, HOOKING UP
LINES/PUMP SHED AND BACK YARD. STRING UP DERRICK (LOAED OUT 105
JT'S DRILL PIPE 4" XT 39 TO RIG 236)

WAIT ON DAY LIGHT

BROKE TOUR TODAY, INSPECT DERRICK TO RAISE AND RAISE DERRICK,
RIG UP FLOOR TUGGER AND INSTAL HAND RAILS, UNBRIDLE, LAY DOWN
PART OF TRACK THAT WAS BENT FROM LAST WELL,SET IN YELLOW DOG,
FILL PITS WITH WATER, CHANGING OIL IN MUD PUMP, HOOK UP STAND
PIPE, THERE WAS HANDS STANDING AROUND WATCHING OTHER HANDS
ON A JOB THAT SHOULD ONLY TAKE TWO HANDS TO DO. GOT WITH
PUSHER AND TOLD HIM THAT HE NEED TO SEPARATE HANDS, ONTO
DIFFERENT TASK'S. SO HE STARTED SEPARATING THE HANDS AND
PUTTING THEM ON DIFFERNT TASK'S.

RIG UP WET SYSTEM ON BAR HOPPER'S HOOK UP CHOKE LINE, KILL LINE,
CHANGE SWABS,LINERS (SHORT TWO BE HERE THIS AM) RIG UP RETURN
LINE ON GAS BUSTER, DRESS SHAKER'S, PUT CULVERT IN FOR MOUSE
HOLE

STACK ANNULAR, ROTATING HEAD, CHANGE LINERS/CHANGED PONY ROD
SEAL'S IN #1 PUMP, PICK UP TOP DRIVE RAIL AND CENTER RAIL TIGHTEN
TURN BUCKLES,INSTALL LANDING AROUND BOPE,PUT IN MOUSE
HOLES-HAD PROBLEMS GETTING THE FRONT ONE IN BUT MANAGED
TO,(NOTIFIED STONY WITH BLM THAT WE'LL BE TESTING IN THE NEXT
24HR.S), PICK UP SWIVEL, BIULT TROUGH ON BACK SIDE OF PITS TO
DIVERT FLUID TO RESERVE PIT.

PICK UP NEW TOP DRIVE (OLD ONE UP FOR SERVICE) HOOK UP TORQUE
TUBE GUIDE (DON'T HAVE THE RIGHT CONNECTION BETWEEN SWIVEL AND
TOP DRIVE (TOP DRIVE HAS NC 61 THREAD INSTEAD OF A 6 5/8 REG) RUN
TOP DRIVE HOSES FIRE UP UNIT AND HOSES LEAKING EVERY WHERE IN
NEW TOP DRIVE (NEW TOP DRIVE HAND FIRST TIME RIGGING UP BY HIM
SELF-LITTLE LOST), FINALY FINISHED LINERS IN PUMPS, FLOW LINE OFF 5"
(WELDER ON HIS WAY),

CHANGED VALVE IN FLOW LINE, WELD FLOW LINE,LAY OUT AND MAKE UP
FLARE LINES, WORK ON SMALL LEAK'S IN GUN LINES READY TO PRESSURE
TEST @ 900AM

WORKING ON TOP DRIVE (NEW HAND THAT IT WAS HIS FIRST TIME
RIGGING UP TOP DRIVE PRESSURED UP UNIT AND BLEW OIL ALL OVER
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS(;ldbe Description of Operations
41712007 09:00-06:00 | 21.00| OTH DIDN'T KNOW WHAT WAS WRONG, JOHN THE HAND THATS BEEN SITTING
ON THIS RIG SHOWED UP TODAY AND SUPT. BILL AND ANOTHER HAND.
THEY TESTED LINES AND FOUND CHECK VALVE BAD AND SEALS BLOWN IN
TOP DRIVE, PULL MOTORS AND REPLACE SEALS
4/8/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00| OTH WORK ON TOP DRIVE, FINISH PUTTING IN MOTOR AND TEST LINES AND
OPERATIONS OF UNIT ALL WORKING CORRECTLY (TORQUE ALL
CONNECTION'S)
10:00 - 14:00 4.00/BOP |1 IPS TIGHTENED CONNECTIONS ON BOPE
14:00-00:00 | 10.00|BOP |2 RIG UP AND PRESSURE TEST TOP DRIVE DOUBLE BALL VALVE DIDN'T TEST
CHANGED DOUBLE BALL VALVE AND IT DIDN'T TEST,TEST THIRD VALVE
TEST TIW, DART VALVE, BLIND, UPPER AND LOWER PIPES, CHOKE
MANIFOLD AND HCR 10 MIN LOW 250 PSI HIGH 10,000 PSI ANNULAR 10 MIN
LOW 250 PSI HIGH 5000 PSI,BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY MESSAGE ON PHONE
(BLM WAS NOT PRESENT FOR TEST) WHILE TESTING MUDDING UP
SURFACE SYSTEM
00:00 - 05:00 5.00| RIG 2 CLEAN RIG FLOOR OF OlL AND REPLACE DRIVE CHAIN ON DRAWWORKS
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{ OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING/ WHEN ISTALLING DRILLER TOLD MOTOR HAND
TO MAKE SURE KOOMY LEVERS WHERE IN THE OPEN POSTION, BUT THE
HCR, WHEN | DISCOVERED THE PROBLEM ALL KOOMY LEVERS WHERE IN
THE OPEN POSTION BUT THE ANNULAR IT WAS SHUT
4/9/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING, COULDN'T COME OUT OF THE HOLE WITH WEAR
BUSHING, LOOK OVER EQUIPMENT AND HYDRILL WAS SHUT, DRILLER
TOLD HAND TO OPEN EVERY THING BUT TO SHUT HCR VALVE, HE SHUT
THE WRONG VALVE, | DISCUSSED WITH DRILLER AND HANDS NOT TO BE
OPERATING FUNTIONS WHILE INSTALLING WEAR BUSHING.
07:00 - 08:00 1.00|TRP |1 RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK, TO PICK UP DRILL PIPE
08:00 - 08:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE MAKE UP SIDE CABLE, BROKE WHEN MAKING UP BIT
08:30 - 15:00 6.50| TRP |1 RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE AND PICK UP BHA AND 3260' OF 5" DRILL PIPE,
TAGGED EARLY AT 44607 THAT IS 1539' ABOVE THE FLOAT SHOE
15:00 - 16:00 1.00{CSG 1 RIG DOWN LAY DOWN TRUCK
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| OTH FILE UNION STARTER THREAD (IT CAME FROM THE REPAIR SHOP WITH
OUT ANY PROTECTION ON IT) AND PICK UP KELLY HOSE AND PUT ON
SWIVEL
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| RIG 2 WORK ON AIR LINES BETWEEN MOTOR SHED'S/ SOME CROSSED LINES
WHEN #3 MOTOR CLUTCH KICKS IN #2 PUMP COMES ON LINE/ WHEN KICK
IN #2 PUMP ENGINE'S THOTTLE UP
18:30 - 19:30 1.00|CIRC |1 FILL PIPE PRESSURED UP AND NO CIRCULATION
19:30 - 22:00 250/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE (WET) )
22:00 - 23:30 1.50| OTH CLEAN RIG FLOOR AFTER WET TRIP AND DRIED MUD FROM DRILL PIPE
PACK OFF ON TOP OF MUD MOTOR AND FIRST IBS, BREAK BIT AND CLEAN
OUT PLUG JETS (PLUGGED WITH CEMENT)
23:30 - 00:00 050/ TRP |2 TRIP IN FIRST STAND AND STAND WITH X-OVER AND PUMP TO SEE IF
MOTOR WAS CLEAN (MOTOR WAS GOOD)
00:00 - 01:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP INTO HOLE TO DRILL OUT CEMENT, BREAK CIRC AFTER BHA
01:30 - 02:00 0.50| OTH CHANGE GRABBER DIES IN TOP DRIVE
02:00 - 03:00 1.00{TRP |2 TRIP IN 3 ROWS
03:00 - 04:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
04:00 - 04:30 0.50| RIG 2 WORK ON SWIVEL PACKING (LEAKING HAD TO HAMMER UP)
04:30 - 05:00 0.50|CIRC |1 BREAK CIRCULATION
05:00 - 05:30 0.50| TRP |2 TRIP IN 3 STANDS
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| REAM {1 WASHING AND REAMING CEMENT IN CASING FROM 4460 TO 4501
4/10/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 4.00| REAM |1 DRILLING CEMENT FROM 4,501 TO 5251 (CEMENT WIPER PLUG WAS @4540)
CEMENT COMING OVER SHAKERS CLUMPY 1/2-1" CHUNKS (HARD)
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:dbe Description of Operations
4/10/2007  110:00 - 11:00 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE GREASE TOP DRIVE AND DRAW TOOL, COMPOUND
+11:00 - 20:00 9.00{ OTH DRILL CEMENT FROM 5251 TO 6120 @ 5715 SANDY CEMENT STARTED
1 COMING OVER SHAKERS (SOFT)
20:00 - 20:30 0.50| CIRC |1 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN FOR FIT TEST
20:30-21:00 .  0.50| OTH PERFORM FIT WITH 8.8 MUD WT 850 PSI = EQUIV. 11.5 MUDWTWITHB & C
QUICK TEST
21:00 - 01:00 400{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6120 TO 6241 (ROP 30.25)
01:00 - 02:30 1.50| RIG 2 WORK ON #1- ROD CLAMP AND #2 PUMP- COULDN'T GET TO PUMP AIRED
UP/ WENT THROUGH PUMP TO SEE IF THERE WAS SOMING UNDER VALVE
COULDN'T FIND ANYTHING
02:30 - 06:00 350{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6241 TO 6295 (ROP 15.4)
4/11/2007 | 06:00 - 14:30 850|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 6295 TO 6474 (ROP 21' HR.) (10-15 WOB, 50 TABLE, PUMPING
BIT UNBALLING SWEEP'S WHEN NEEDED AND TRICKLE NUT SHELL OVER
SUCTION IN TANK, ALSO ON CONNECTIONS DROPPING SOAP STICKS AND
i SAPP/ SOFT GUMMY CLAY COMING OVER SHAKERS)
114:30 - 15:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG
i15:30-06:00 | 1450/ DRL |1 DRILL FROM 6474 TO 6775 (ROP 20.75' HR)
4/12/2007  {06:00 - 09:30 350{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6775 - 6850, 75', 21.42 FPH, 19K WOB, 92 RPM DOWM HOLE,
50 RPM ON SURFACE. HELD STAND DOWN SAFETY MEETING ON 3
ACCIDENTS ON QEP LOCATIONS.
09:30 - 10:30 1.00|RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION LOWER PIPE RAMS
10:30 - 14:30 4.00|DRL |1 DRILL 6850 - 6945', 95", 23.75 FPH, 19K WOB, 92 RPM DH, 50 RPM ON
SURFACE. PUMPING LCM & BIT BALLNG SWEEPS AS NEEDED. CEMENTED
BASE PLATE ON WELL HEAD W/ 5 YDS OF REDIMIX FROM PETE MARTIN.
14:30 - 15:30 1.00/SUR |1 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 6874', .5 DEG. @ 147.4
15:30-06:00 | 14.50|DRL |1 DRILL 6945' - 7351, 406', 28 FPH, WOB 15-20K, 92 RPM DOWN HOLE, 50 RPM
ON SURFACE, STILL PUMPING LCM & BIT BALLING SWEEPS AS NEEDED.
TOTAL LOSSES TODAY 200 BBL.
4/13/2007 | 06:00 - 12:00 6.00|DRL |1 DRILL 7351' - 7508', 157", 26.16 FPH, WOB 15-20K, 92 RPM DOWN HOLE, 50
RPM ON MOTOR. SLIGHT BIT BALLING, NO NOTICEABLE LOSSES SO FAR
TODAY.
12:00 - 13:00 1.00/SUR |1 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 7438', .6 DEG. 202.
13:00 - 16:30 350 DRL |1 DRILL 7508 - 7603', 95', 27.14 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWN HOLE.
16:30 - 17:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
17:30-06:00 | 1250/ DRL |1 DRILL 7603' - 7905', 302", 24.16 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWN HOLE. TOTAL LOSSES TODAY 125 BBL. SLIGHT SEEPAGE HOLE IN
GOOD CONDITION. ONLY SMALL SLOUGH & VERY LITTLE OF THAT.
4/14/2007 | 06:00 - 09:00 3.00/{DRL (1 DRILL 7905' - 7983', 78', 26 FPH. WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE & 91
DOWN HOLE. MINIMAL SEEPAGE, NO INCREASE IN SLOUGH.
09:00 - 10:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
10:00 - 15:00 500/DRL |1 DRILL 7983 - 8076', 93, 18.6 FPH, WOB 15-21K, RPM 50 ON SURFACE, 91
DOWN HOLE. TOTAL LOSSES TO TRIP = 185 BBL, SEEPAGE & DUMPING
SAND TRAPS.
15:00 - 19:30 450/ TRP 10 PUMP PILL & TOH W/ BIT #13.
19:30 - 20:30 100, TRP |10 BREAK OFF BIT, PU NEW BIT, FUNCTION BLIND RAMS
20:30 - 00:00 350|TRP |10 TIH W/ BIT #14, CHANGE OUT CORROSION RING. GOOD TRIP.
00:00 - 00:30 0.50{ REAM |1 WA&R 90' TO BOTTOM, 10 OF FILL, LOST 30 BBL ON TRIP. 10 BBL OF IT WET
PIPE.
00:30 - 06:00 550/ DRL |1 DRILL 8076' - 8280", 204, 37.09 FPH, WOB 11-15K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWN HOLE. VERY SLIGHT SEEPAGE.
4/15/2007 | 06:00 - 10:30 450{DRL |1 DRILL 8280 - 8453, 173, 38.44 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE &
91 DOWN HOLE, NO NOTICEABLE LOSSES AS OF YET. VERY LITTLE
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code g‘;’dbe Description of Operations
4/15/2007 | 06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 SLOUGH. N
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE. FUNCTION LOWER PIPE RAMS.
11:30-06:00 | 1850/ DRL |1 DRILL 8453 - 8818, 365', 19.72 FPH, WOB 15-20k, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,

91 DOWN HOLE. PUMPING BIT BALLING SWEEPS @ 1/2 - 1 HR INTERVALS
SOME TIMES IT HELPS BUT ONLY FOR 3-4'. VERY SLIGHT SEEPAGE LAST 24
HRS.

4/16/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00| DRL 1 DRILL 8818' - 8932', 114', 28.5 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWNHOLE. STILL PUMPING BIT BALLING SWEEPS @ 1/2- 1 HR
INTREVALS. SEEPAGE MINIMAL

10:00 - 11:.00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION ANNULAR & CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC

11:00 - 06:00 19.00| DRL 1 DRILL 8932 - 9511', 579", 30.47 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,
100 DOWN HOLE INCREASED PUMPS TO 418 GPM. VERY SLIGHT SEEPAGE.

4/17/2007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL 9511 - 9608', 97', 27.71 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,

100 DOWN HOLE. BIT JUST KEEPS HANGING IN. SEEPAGE MINIMAL.

09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE FILTER ON CHAIN OILER ON COMPOUND.

10:00 - 12:30 2.50| DRL 1 DRILL 9608 - 9704, 96', 38.4 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURVACE,100

' DOWN HOLE

12:30- 13:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, ADJUST BRAKES, ADD SAFETY CHAINS TO BALE
EXTENSION, & FUNCTION LOWER PIPE RAMS.

13:30 - 06:00 16.50| DRL 1 DRILL 9704 - 10200, 496", 30.06 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,

100 DOWN HOLE. HOLE TAKING A LITTLE MORE FLUID THE LAST 3 HRS,
ABOUT 10 BBL. PUMPED 10% LCM SWEEP, STILL PUMPING BIT BALLING
SWEEP EVERY HALF HR SINCE 22:00. FIRST TIGHT CONN @ 10181’ ABOUT
25K OVER. REAMED BACK THROUGH IT AND DIDN'T SEE IT.

4/18/2007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL 10200 - 10342, 142", 40.6 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,
100 DOWN HOLE, TRIPPING BIT ON HOURS ONLY.
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| CIRC 1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP.
10:30- 11:00 0.50 DROP SURVEY @ 10362’ .6 202, SAME AS LAST SURVEY. DRILLER CHECKED

SURVEY. WHEN | CHECKED IT IT WAS 89.6 @ 68.9, POSSIBLE MIS-RUN. |
THINK IT TOOK A SURVEY ON THE BENCH, BUT CANT TELL FOR SURE.

11:00 - 18:00 7.00| TRP 10 PUMP PILL, TOH W/ BIT #14, PULL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER, BREAK OFF
BIT, LD MUD MOTOR.

18:00 - 19:00 1.00| TRP 10 PU NEW BIT # 15, NEW MOTOR, & TIH TO JARS. JARS HAD TOP SEAL OUT OF
MANDREL, LD JARS. #1 4/17/07

19:00 - 20:00 1.00|RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE, 180

20:00 - 21:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, TOP DRIVE, & FUNCTION ANNULAR

21:00 - 22:00 1.00| WOT 5 WO, STRAP & PU JARS. #2 4/17/07

22:00 - 03:30 5.50| TRP 10 TIH, BREAK CIRC AT BHA, & EA. 3 ROWS TO BOTTOM 1 STAND OFF BOTTOM
TIGHT, PACKED OFF.

03:30 - 05:00 1.50| FISH [ WORK TIGHT HOLE, SET OFF JARS 3 TIMES EASY, FOUND FREE SPOT,
BREAK CRC. BACK REAM OUT TO 10208'

05:00 - 06:00 1.00|REAM |1 WA&R 10208’ - 10300

4/19/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| REAM |1 Wa&R 10300 - 10342, 36" OF FILL,LOTS OF PRESSURED SLOUGH BUT

NOTHING LARGE.

07:00 - 12:00 5.00| DRL 1 DRILL 10342 - 10541", 199", 39.8 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 124, 65 ON SURFACE,
59 DOWN HOLE. NO NOTICABLE SEEPAGE TO THIS POINT. BOP DRILL.

12:00 - 13:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS

13:00 - DRL 1 DRILL 10541 - 11060, 519', 30.52 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 110, 50 ON

SURFACE, 60 DOWN HOLE, NO NOTICEABLE SEEPAGE LAST 24
HRS.PUMPING BIT BALLING SWEEPS IN SLOW DRILLING SPOTS.
4/20/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50| DRL 1 DRILL 11060' - 11207, 147", 32.66 FPH, WOB 15 - 20K, RPM 110, 50 ON
SURFACE, 60 DOWN HOLE, NO NOTICEABLE SEEPAGE TO THIS POINT.
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csol:jbe Description of Operations
4/20/2007  |10:30 - 11:30 1.00|RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION ANNULAR, ADJUST BRAKES.

11:30 - 14:00 2.50| DRL. 1 DRILL 10207’ - 11301", 94', 37.6 FPH, WOB 15-20, RPM 100, 50 ON SURFACE,
60 DOWN HOLE, TOP DRIVE WILL NOT TURN OVER 50 RPM ON SURFACE. IT
WILL TURN 70 OFF BOTTOM BUT FALLS TO 50 WHEN YOU PUT IT ON

BOTTOM.
14:00 - 18:00 4.00| RIG 8 REPLACE AIR VALVE & LINDE PUMP ON TOP DRIVE.
18:00 - 05:00 11.00| DRL 1 DRILL 11301 - 11488', 187", 17 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 120, 60 DOWN HOLE, 60

ON SURFACE. HOLE STARTED TAKING FLIUD @ 11380, SHOW 11382' - 11400’
600u, 6637u, 3800u. TRIED TO GO THROUGH BUSTER BUT ROTATING HEAD

LEAKING BAD.

05:00 - 06:00 1.00| RIG 4 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD, SEAL GONE WHEN WE PULLED HEAD,
DONT THINK ONE WAS INSTALLED AFTER LAST TRIP.

4/24/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00{ DRL 1 DRILL 11488' - 11561', 73", 24.33 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 119, 60 ON SURFACE,

59 DOWN HOLE. ROTATIG HEAD LOCKED UP, WORE RUBBER OUT.

09:00 - 10:00 1.00| RIG 4 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD RUBBERS.

10:00 - 13:00 3.00| DRL 1 DRILL 11561 - 11614', 53', 17.66 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 119, 60 ON
SURFACE, 59 DOWN HOLE. LOSSES SEEM TO BE SLOWING.

13:00 - 14.00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE.

14:00 - 00:30 10.50| DRL 1 DRILL 11614’ - 11724 110°,10.47 FPH, WOB 20-25K, RPM 118, 60 ON SURFACE,

59 DOWN HOLE. LOOSING ABOUT 2-4 BBL HR OF FLUID, RAISING MW TO
CONTROL GAS, DRILLING FLARE 15-25', CONN FLARE 35'

00:30 - 06:00 6.50| CIRC 1 DRILLING SLOWED TO 4 FPH, SHUT DOWN TO RAISE MW F/ BIT TRIP. BBG
THROUGH BUSTER 1500 - 2500u MW 10.2, HEADED F/ 10.4. BYPASSED
SHAKERS TO KEEP LCM IN SYSTEM.

4/22/2007 06:00 - 23:30 17.50| CIRC 1 C&C F/ BIT TRIP. MW HEADED F/ 10.2 - 10.8. GAS @ 10.8 IS STILL 725u
THROUGH THE BUSTER, SPOTTED 160 BBL OF 12.2PPG MUD ON BOTTOM.
ESTIMATE TOP OF PILL @ 9981
23:30-01:00 1.50| TRP 10 TOH 22 STANDS SLOW & WET. TO 9653', GAINED 8 BBL OF FLUID PULLING 22
STANDS.
01:00 - 04:00 3.00|CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP TO CLEAN UP GAS. GAS ON BUSTER 650u. MIXED PILL
WHILE CIRC.
04:00 - 06:00 2.00| CIRC 1 CHECK F/ FLOW, FLOWING 1/2" STREAM, RAISING MW TO 11.0 PPG.
4/23/2007 06:00 - 00:00 18.00| CIRC 1 C&C, RAISING MW F/ 10.8 - 11.8, HAD 11.7 COMMING BACK & LOST
COMPLETE RETURNS @ 23:49 LCM 12%
00:00 - 01:00 100/ CIRC |2 MIXING LCM & MUD, LETTING MW DROP BACK TO 11.7 BRINGING LCM TO
15%
01:00 - 06:00 5.00| CIRC 1 C&C, BUILD VOLUME, WT @ 11.7, LCM @ 20%, LOSSES @ 17 BPH, SEEM TO
BE SLOWING A LITTLE, AROUND 7 BPH AS NEAR AS | CAN TELL AT THIS
TIME.
4/24/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50| CIRC 1 C&C, MIXING MUD & BUILD VOLUME. CHECKED FLOW @ 08:00, NO FLOW.

C&C BUILD PREMIX, GUN LINES PLUGGED OFF, & BAR HOPPER @ PREMIX
PLUGGING @ 4X3" SAWGE. CHECKED F/ FLOW @ 11:15, FLOWING 1"
STREAM & SURGING TO 4" -6" STREAM FIRST TIME WE HAVE SEEN THIS
SURGING. TAKING PREMIX TO 12.2 PPG W/ 30% LCM.

13:30 - 14:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION HCR VALVE, CHECK FLOW, NO
FLOW. 11.8PPG MW.

14:00 - 18:00 4.00| CIRC 1 C&C, BUILD PREMIX, 12.2 PPG MW, 30% LCM & SPOT F/ 9653' - 6745'
CALCULATED OH.

18:00 - 03:30 9.50| TRP 10 TOH TO 6107', PUMP TRIP PILL. CONTINUE W/ SLOW TOH, LD BIT & MOTOR.
NO LOSSES ON TOH.

03:30 - 06:00 2.50| TRP 10 PU HUNTING .22 MOTOR SN 6142 , DOG SUB, HTC 406Z BIT SN 7301750 BIT
#16, & TIH SLOW
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS;ldbe Description of Operations
4/25/2007 | 06:00 - 08:30 250{TRP |10 TIH SLOW,BREAK CIRC EVERY 3 ROWS TO SHOE
08:30 - 09:00 050/ TRP {10  :CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD
09:00 - 10:00 1.00|CIRC |1 ICIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @ THE SHOE, GAS PEAKED @ 4899u, 10-15'
FLARE.
10:00 - 16:00 6.00| TRP |10 TIH CIRCULATING BOTTOMS UP EVERY ROW , BOTTOMS UP FLARE ON
LAST ROW 40 + 44 BBL GAIN.
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| REAM |1 W&R 470' TO BOTTOM, 36' OF FILL BOTTOMS UP FLARE 50", GAINED 55 BBL.
17:00 - 18:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRC OUT GAS.
18:00-06:00 | 12.00(DRL |1 DRILL 11724' - 11839, 115", WOB 18-25K, RPM 142, 92 DOWN HOLE, 50 ON
SURFACE NO LOSSES THIS MORNING. MW 12.0, LCM 25% STILL BY PASSING
SHAKERS.
4/26/2007  |06:00 - 12:30 6.50/ DRL |1 DRILL 11839' - 11867', 28'4.3 FPH, WOB 25K, RPM 142, 92 DOWN HOLE, 50 ON
SURFACE. PLAYED W/ RPM & WOB BUT THATS ALL WE COULD GET OUT OF
THIS BIT.
12:30 - 13:30 100{SUR |1 DROP SURVEY @ 11797 (MISS RUN)
13:30 - 14:30 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRC & FINISH MIXING TRIP PILL.
14:30 - 18:00 350/ TRP |10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE SLOW
18:00 - 21:00 3.00|TRP |1 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
21:00 - 21:30 0.50{TRP |1 CHANGE OUT BIT'S/ RETREIVE SURVEY/ FUNTION TEST BLINDS AND PIPE
RAMS
21:30 - 02:00 450/TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE, FILL EVERY 3 ROWS, INSTALL ROT. RUBBER
02:00 - 02:30 050/ CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @ SHOE 110 PEAK GAS
02:30 - 05:30 3.00|/TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE FILL PIPE AND BREAK CIRCULATION 8785,10,794
05:30 - 06:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE/ WASH @ 10,794
4/27/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 100/ TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 11744
07:00 - 08:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 11,744 TO 11,867 25 FT FILL
08:00 - 13:00 5.00/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 11,867 TO 11,924 (ROP 11.4) (STARTED SHAKIING OUT LCM
SLOWLY OVER 1 SHAKER @ 10:30 am) MW 11.7/GAS 180 UNIT'S/ ON
CONNECTION WORKED THROUGH TIGHT SPOT @ 11,890 UP TO 11,870
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE (SERVICE TOP DRIVE, COMPOUND)
14:00 - 18:00 400/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 11,924 TO 11,965 (ROP 10.25 FT HR)
18:00-06:00 | 12.00(DRL |1 DRILL FROM 11,965 TO 12,076 (ROP 9.25 FT HR) SLOWWED TO 4-5 FT HR
FROM 11,975-12,003
4/28/2007  |06:00 - 13:00 7.00|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,076 TO 12,209 (ROP 19 FT HR) SHAKING LCM OUT DOWN TO
8-10% WOB 10-15, DHRPM 142, STARTED SEEPING WHEN WT UP TO 11.7+,
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, TOP DRIVE, (REPLACE QUIK RELEASE ON #1 MOTOR
CLUTCH)
14:00 - 18:30 450/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,209 TO 12,256 (ROP 10.4 FT HR) HIT BLACK HAWK SAND
TOOK KICK
18:30 - 02:30 8.00/CIRC |1 CIRCULATE THROUGH CHOKE WEIGHTING UP MUD SLOWLY 1-2 POINTS A
CIRCULATION NOT WANTING TO KNOCK THE BOTTOM OUT/ BRING UP LCM
TO 20%-25%
02:30 - 06:00 3.50|CIRC |2 STARTED LOSSING CIRCULATION WHEN MUD WEIGHT REACHED 12.3
PPG,SLOWWED PUMP DOWN AND PUMP HI LCM SWEEP,
4/20/2007  |06:00-02:30 | 20.50|CIRC |2 FIGHT LOST CIRCULATION, PIPES SHUTIN AND GAS SOMETIMES OVER 3000
UNIT'S, PUMPING LCM SWEEPS EVERY HALF HOUR AND BRINGING MUD
WEIGHT UP 1 POINT PER CIRCULATION WHILE GOING THROUGH CHOKE,
02:30 - 06:00 3.50{DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,256 TO 12,285 (ROP 8.25 FT HR) BRING WT UP TO CONTROL
BACK GROUND GAS
4/30/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 200/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,285 TO 12,303 (ROP 9 FT HR.) 2-3 BBL LOSS 25-28% LCM,
08:00 - 09:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE, COMPOUND, BLOCKS
09:00-06:00 | 21.00/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,303 TO 12,471' ( ROP 8' FT. HR. ) 2-3 BBLS LOSS
5/1/2007 06:00 - 08:00 200/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,470 TO 12,490 (ROP 10' HR) MW 12.7WOB 20-25/ DHRPM 130

Printed: 5/2/2007 $:14:30 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code (?:dbe Description of Operations
5/1/2007 06:00 - 08:00 200[DRL |1 SHAKE LCM OUT TO 10% LCM IN SYSTEM
08:00-21:00 | 13.00| RIG 2 REPAIR RIGIMASTER CLUTCH BOOT HAS HOLE IN IT, (NEW ONE COMING
FROM CASPER AND TWO MECHANICS)
21:00 - 06:00 9.00[DRL i1 DRILL FROM 12,490 TO 12,600 ( ROP 12.2 HR ) MW 12.7/WOB 20-25/DHRPM
130
5/2/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,600 TO 12,612 (ROP 4.8 FT HR)
08:30 - 10:30 2.00|CIRC |7 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP FOR SAMPLE/MUD LOGGER
10:30 - 17:00 6.50| RIG 2 SHORT TRIP OUT 50 STANDS SLOW BECAUSE OF AIR ISSUES WITH
MASTER CLUTCH (WHEN THEY THROTTLE UP ON DRAWWORKS ABOUT
HALF THROTTLE IT KICK'S OUT THE MASTER CLUCH), (TIGHT SPOTS WERE
AT 12,225 TO 12,12,215 AND 11,960 TO 11,950 AND 11,925 TO 11,910) WORK
UP AND DOWN THROUGH TIGHT SPOTS/ WHILE TRIPPING ALSO WAS
TRYING TO WORK ON MASTER CLUTCH TO FIGURE OUT PROBLEM WITH IT,
17:00 - 21:00 400|TRP |14 TRIP IN HOLE 50 STANDS BREAKING CIRCULATION EVERY 22 JT.S/ WASHED
25' OF SOFT FILL(MOTOR IS REAL WEAK)
21:00 - 02:30 550/ CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND GET MUD PROPERIES INTO SHAPE(12.7+) BOTTOMS UP
FLARE 25™-30"/PIT GAIN 86 BBL.S/ WITH ECD.S FLARE IS 2-3'
02:30 - 03:30 1.00|CIRC |1 FLOW CHECK - OK - DROP SURVEY
03:30 - 06:00 250/ TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN 7" LINER & STRAP OUT OF HOLE

Printed: 5/2/2007 9:14:30 AM




Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(November 1954) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 22,‘,?;“};1,;‘3"1‘,1';32
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-02510A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an BT gﬁi’- Ifgndian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. C; § % R :
Y INA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side 7 Uit or ChAgreement Name ndlore
1. Type of Well WHITE RIVER UNIT
C—Joit wet X1 Gaswell _[__] Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator GB 1M-4-8-22R
Questar Exploration & Production Company Contact: Jan Nelson 9. APIWell No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-38990
1571 East 1700 South Vemal, Utah 84078 435-781-4032 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
3 WHITE RIVER
1147' FNL 474’ FWL, LOT 8, SECTION 4, T8S, R22E 11. County or Parish, State
UINTAH
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
_motice of Intent [ Acidize ] Deepen ] Production (Start/Resume) ] water Shut-Off
] Alter Casing {1 Fracture Treat E] Reclamation [j Well Integrity
D Subsequent Report [ Casing Repair ] New Construction 1 Recomplete Other
I:X] Change Plans D Plug and Abandon [:l Temporarily Abandon TD CHANGE
[ Final Abandonment Notice [ Convert to Injection 1 piug Back [ water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximatc duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recompletc  horizontally, give subsurface locations and measmired and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be perfamed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
Following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

< Tudi :

Testing has been pleted Final Aband Notices shall be filed only after all req recl have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

Questar Exploration & Production Company proposes to extend the TD to 17,075’ to the Dakota formation.
TD was permitted to 16,700'.  Cement volumes will be adjusted accordingly.

Approved by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

14. 1hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed/Typed) Title
Laura Bills Regulatory Affairs

Signature . Date
‘ ZEQ.@Q Z i é% May 17, 2007

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE _

Approved by Title IDate

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify Office
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would
entitle the applicant to conduct operations th

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfuily to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or

fraudulent or jons as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

P

netractions on revese) RECEIVED

MAY 138 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN s/ 3 -0Y 7 -39 990 Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code g«;ldbe Description of Operations
1/24/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 200{LOC |4 RIG DOWN TO SKID RIG FOR TRUCKS
08:00 - 10:00 2.00 RIG UP CRAINE, TRUCKS TO PULL FRONT TWO MATS
10:00 - 15:30 5.50|LOC |4 DIG CELLAR IN STALL RING
15:30 - 17:00 1.50|LOC |4 SLID RIG 10' AHEAD W/ 4 TRUCKS, CRAINE , 2 D-8 CATS
17:00 - 00:00 7.00{LOC |4 RIG BACK UP FRONT YARD
00:00 - 06:00 6.00|TRP |1 PICK UP DP STAND IN DERRICK
1/25/2007 | 06:00 - 10:00 400/LOoC |4 SET GAS BUSTER, CHOKE HOUSE IN W/ CRAIN, FLOW LINE
10:00 - 12:00 2.00 TRYING TO SCREW IN TO BHA STANDING DERRICK
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 KICK PUMPS IN FROZE IN TOP DRIVE
13:00 - 16:00 3.00 STAND BHA BACK IN DERRICK TOP DRIVE BACK OUT DRILL PIPE IN TOP OF
MONEL DC HAD TO GET SCREWED BACK IN MONEL DC
16:00 - 17:00 1.00|RIG |5 UNTHAW TOP DRIVE IN UPPER KELLY COCK
17:00 - 18:00 1.00|TRP |1 PICK UP BHA
18:00 - 21:00 3.00/DRL |1 SPUD IN 17 1/2 HOLE @ 1800 1/24/2007 DRILLING F/21 TO 47'
21:00 - 22:00 100(RIG |2 TIGHT UP STAND PIPE UNION
22:00 - 02:30 450/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 47 TO 258
02:30 - 05:00 250|TRP |2 LAY DOWN 6 DP, TO 2 STD 6 5/8 HWD
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH 90' TO BOTTOM
1/26/2007 | 06:00 - 06:30 0.50[ SUR |1 SURVEY @ 261 1.2 DEG 54.0 AZ
06:30 - 10:30 400|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 258 TO 350
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 CLEAN OUT SUCTION&DISCHARGE LINE ON CELLAR PUMP
11:00 - 11:30 050|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 350 TO 374
11:30 - 12:30 1.00|TRP |2 L/D 5 JTS. PIPE & RUN IN 6 5/8 HWD
12:30 - 16:30 400|DRL |1 DRILLING F/374 TO 526'
16:30 - 17:00 0.50|SUR |1 SURVEY @ 476' 1.7 DEG 39.4 AZ
17:00 - 18:30 150|TRP  [14  |SHORT TRIP TO BIT( SLM BOARD 526.0 STRAP 528.33 NO CORR))
18:30 - 19:30 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRC. SWEEP AROUND RUN 13 3/8 CSG.
19:30 - 22:00 250|TRP |2 TRIP OUT RUN 13 3/8 CASING, L/D 1BS, SHOCK SUB
22:00 - 00:00 200|CSG |1 RIG UP CASING CREW, CHANGE OUT BAILES ON TOP DRIVE
00:00 - 03:00 3.00|CSG |2 RUN 12 JTS 13 5/8 CASING K-55 # 54.5 W/ WESTSTATE CASING
03:00 - 04:00 100[CIRC |1 RIG UP CIRC 13 3/8 CSG.
04:00 - 06:00 200|CMT |2 RIG CMT. HELD SAFTY MEETING CMT. 13 3/8 CSG
1/27/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 100{CMT |2 CEMENT 13 3/8 CSG. W/ 500 SK. TYP 3 0.2 VERASET, 1% CALCIUM CHLORID,
0.125#/SK POLYFLACK #14.5 PPG.YIELD 1.40 RETRUNED 9.5 BBL TO PIT
FLOAT HELD.PLUG DOWN @ 06:30 RIG DOWN CEMENTER
07:00 - 12:00 500/ WOT |1 woc
12:00 - 18:00 6.00|BOP |1 CUT OFF PIPE, CHIP CMT DOWN 1 FT. FOR BASE PLATE ON HEAD, WELD ON
HEAD, TEST TO 1,000 PSI
18:00-06:00 | 12.00/BOP (1 NIPPLE UP BOPS
1/28/2007  106:00-19:00 | 13.00|BOP |2 TEST BOPS,HAD RETIGHT ALL FLANGE, TESTED HYDRILL, WING VAVLES,
UNTHAW HCR VALVE,TESTED HCR
19:00 - 20:00 100|RIG |2 CHANGE OUT 4 1/2 PIPE RAMS, BLOCKS
20:00 - 22:00 200/BOP |2 TEST UPPER KELLY,
22:00 - 00:00 200|RIG |2 FLIP PIPE RAMS OVER
00:00 - 01:00 100(BOP |2 CHANGE OUT TEST JT.UNTHAW TOP DRIVE
01:00 - 02:00 100|BOP |2 RETEST PIPE RAMS,NO GOOD
02:00 - 06:00 400(RIG |2 NIPPLE DOWN BOPS,WAIT ON NEW DOUBLE GATE FROM QUAIL OUT
CASPER SHOULD BE HEAR @ 12:00 TO DAY
1/29/2007  |06:00-17:00 | 11.00| WOT |4 NIPPE DOWN BOPS , WAIT ON DOUBLE GATE F/ QUAIL IN CASPER,
UNTHAW KELLY HOSE,PUT KELLY HOSE EXT.PIPE ON TO KEEP HOSE OFF
TOP DRIVE
17:00 - 23:00 6.00|BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOPS
23:00 - 06:00 7.00/BOP |2 TEST BOPS PIPE RAMS, BLINDS, CHOKE MANFOILD, WING VALVE, HCR,

Printed: 6/8/2007 2:24:13 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Ctséjc?e Description of Operations
1/29/2007  |23:00 - 06:00 7.00{BOP |2 CHECK VALVE UPPER, LOEWR KELLY VAVLE, LOW, 250 PSI 5MINS, HIGH

5,000 10 MIN, HY DRILL 250 LOW 5MIN. HIGH 2500 PSI 10 MINS. TEST
CASING TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MINS OK

1/30/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50|RIG 2 NIPPLE DOWN ROTATING HEAD ADD 14" TO SPOOL WAIT ON WELDER,
REDUE SPOOL FOR ROTATING HEAD, INSTALL WEAR BUSHING, DRILL
MOUSE HOLE,
13:30 - 19:00 5.50| RIG 2 NIPPLE UP ROTATING HEAD, HOOK UP FLOW LINE
19:00 - 20:30 1.50| BOP 1 PUT TRUN BUCKLES ON BOP , CENTER BOP UP TO ROTARY TABLE
20:30 - 00:00 3.50| TRP 1 P/ UP BHA
00:00 - 01:00 1.00| TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE TAGED CMT AT 470"
01:00 - 04:30 3.50{DRL 1 DRILLING CMT ,FLOAT COLLAR, SHOE, & 10’ NEW HOLE
04:30 - 05:30 1.00| EQT 2 RIG UP, FIT TEST TO 61 PSI = 10.5 MUD WT BLEAD OFF 10 PSI IN 5MINS
TESTED W/ SINGLE JACK TESTING
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| TRP 3 LAY DOWN SLICK JT . DP, UP SPIRAL HWDP
1/31/2007 06.00 - 09:30 3.50| DRL 1 DRILLING F/ 526 TO 720
09:30 - 11:00 150/CIRC (1 CIRC WHILE WORKING ON PASON EQUIPT.
11:00 - 12:30 1.50| DRL 1 DRILLING F/ 720 TO 812
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| OTH CIRC. WORK ON TOP DRIVE STALLING OUT W/ 10,000 WT
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| DRL 1 DRILLING F/812 TO 830
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| OTH CIRC. WORK ON TOP DRIVE
14:00 - 15:30 1.50( DRL 1 DRILLING F/ 830 TO 904
156:30 - 16.00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER.
16:00 - 17:30 1.50( DRL 1 DRILLING F/ 904 TO 953
17:30 - 20:00 2.50| OTH WORK ON TOP DRIVE FILLTER COLAPSED
20:00 - 20:30 0.50| DRL 1 DRILL F/ 953 TO 1035
20:30 - 21:30 1.00{ SUR 1 SURVEY @ 1,0000 1.6 DEG 352 AZ
21:30 - 01:00 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL F/ 1035 TO 1147
01:00 - 02:30 1.50| OTH CIRCULATE AND WORK PIPE WHILE CHANGE OUT FLITERS ON TOP DRIVE
12 FILTERS ALL IN BAD CONDITION.
02:30 - 06:00 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL F/ 1147' TO 1250
2/1/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00{ DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 1250" TO 1483'
13:00 - 15:30 2.50| RIG 2 WAITTING ON WELDER AND REPAIR STAND PIPE
15:30 - 17.00 1.50| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 1483’ TO 1514’
17:00 - 18:.00 1.00| SUR 1 RAN WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 1444' 1.9 DEG. 37.30 AZI
18:00 - 20:30 2.50| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 1514' TO 1544’
20:30 - 23:00 2.50| TRP 13 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CASING SHOE DUE TO MOTOR FAILURE ON TOP

DRIVE

23:00 - 03:00 4.00( RIG 2 CHANGE OUT TOP MOTOR ON TOP DRIVE, AND TESTED MOTOR
03:00 - 04:30 1.50| TRP 13 TRIP IN HOLE TO 1079’

04:30 - 06:00 1.50{ REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 1079 TO 1544

2/2/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 1544’ TO 1734’

13:00 - 15:30 2.50| OTH REPAIR PASON

15:30 - 20:30 5.00| RIG 2 WELDER REPAIR DISCHARGE LINE ON PUMP # 2
20:30 - 22:00 1.50 | DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 1734' TO 1796

22:00 - 23:00 1.00| CIRC 1 MADE CONNECTION HOLE PACKING OFF BENT TWO JOINTS PIPE

CIRCULATED H! VIS SWEEP

23:00 - 00:30 1.50| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 1796' TO 1801

00:30 - 02:00 1.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP CHANGE SWAB #1 PUMP
02:00 - 06:00 4.00| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM TO 1801' TO 1920

2/3/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 1800’ TO 2017

11:00- 11:30 0.50| RIG 1 SERVISE RIGRIG SERVICE
111:30 - 12:00 0.50| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD

12:00 - 22:00 10.00| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 2017 TO 2203

Printed: 6/8/2007 2:24:13 PM



QuestarE & P Page 3 of 23

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code (:S(;’dbe Description of Operations
2/3/2007 22:00 - 22:30 0.50| OTH REPAIR TOP DRIVE
22:30 - 23:00 0.50{SUR |1 WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 2133' 1.7 DEG. 36.2 AZM
23:00 - 06:00 7.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2203 TO 2275'
2/4/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2275' TO 2309’
08:30 - 09:00 0.50{CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEPS AND CIRCULATE
09:00 - 12:30 3.50{TRP |10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT
12:30 - 14:30 2.00{TRP |10 CHANGE OUT BIT AND TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE TOP DRIVE
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE HIT BRIDGE AT 873'
15:30 - 23:00 7.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 873' TO 2164 EXCESSIVE AMOUNTS OF PEE
GRAVEL COMING BACK ACROSS SHALE SHAKERS, RAISING WT AND VIS
23:00 - 00:00 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT KELLY SAVER SUB
00:00 - 05:00 500|TRP {10 PACKED OFF WORKING TIGHT HOLE FROM 2164 BACK REAM UP TO
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRC. AND RAISE WT TO 9.2, VIS TO 40, REAMING TO BOTTOM
2/5/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 2197 TO 2314
08:30 - 14:00 5.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2309 TO 2390
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
14:30-06:00 | 15.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2390 TO 2757
06:00 - NOTE: AFTER RAISING VIS AND WT, TORQUE WENT AWAY
2/6/2007 06:00 - 09:30 350/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2757 TO 2832
09:30 - 10:00 0.50{RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
10:00 - 12:30 250/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2832 TO 2895
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, FILL # 2 PUMP MOTOR WITH ANTIFREEZE
13:00-06:00 | 17.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2895 TO 3230
2/7/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3230 TO 3275
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR DAY TANK ON # 2 PUMP RAN OUT OF FUEL
07:30 - 10:30 3.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3275 TO 3339
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
11:00-00:30 | 13.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3339 TO 3593
00:30 - 01:30 1.00|RIG 2 RIG REPAIR # 2 PUMP, REPLACED VALVE & SEAT IN SUCTION
01:30 - 06:00 450/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3593 TO 3664
2/8/2007 06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3664 TO 3750
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT MIDDLE DISCHARGE VALVE AND SEAT # 1 PUMP
11:30 - 17:00 5.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3750 TO 3847
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
18:00 - 19:00 100|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3847 TO 3870
19:00 - 21:00 2.00|TRP |13 PRESSURE LOSS, BIT QUIT DRILLING, LOOKING FOR PRESSURE LOSS
WENT THROUGH BOTH PUMPS
21:00 - 22:00 1.00|TRP  [13 MIX UP PILL
22:00 - 22:30 0.50|TRP |13 DROP SURVEY
22:30 - 23:00 0.50| TRP (13 PUMP PILL
23:00 - 01:30 250{TRP |13 TRIP OUT FOR MOTOR
01:30 - 06:00 450|TRP |13 TWO 2" HOSES BLEW INTO BETWEEN TOP DRIVE UNIT AND 1/4 WAY UP
DERRICK, WHILE BREAKING OUT SAVER SUB TO PULL OUT HWDP
06:00 - NOTE: HAD 6 TH MAN CHANGE LINERS IN #1 PUMP TO 5 1/2
2/9/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| OTH WORKING ON TESCO TOP DRIVE, REPLACING 2" HOSES, PROBLEMS W/
BACK PRESSURE ON GRABBER
12:30 - 13:30 1.00|TRP |13 TRIP OUT TO SHOE
13:30 - 15:00 1.50| OTH WORKING ON BACKPRESSURE ON GRABBER, REPLACE CHECK VALVE
15:00 - 18:00 3.00{TRP |1 TRIP OUT , CHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR, CLOSE AND OPEN BLINDS, PIPES
AND HYDRIL
18:00 - 23:00 5.00{TRP |13 TRIP IN TO 1100, HIT BRIDGE, COULD NOT CIRCULATE THROUGH STRING

Printed: 6/8/2007 2:24:13 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code géjdbe Description of Operations
2192007 23:00 - 02:00 3.00{TRP |13 TRIP OUT TO MOTOR,
02:00 - 04:00 2.00{TRP |13 FLOAT BROKE, CLEAN JUNK OUT OF MOTOR
04:00 - 05:30 150{TRP |2 TRIP IN WITH MOTOR AND IBS, CIRCULATE THROUGH BHA, GOOD
05:30 - 06:00 0.50|TRP |2 TRIP IN WITH BHA
2/10/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 100{TRP |2 TRIP INTO 1100
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| OTH INSTALL TRIP SLEEVE IN ROTATING HEAD
07:30 - 16:00 8.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 1100° TO 3183
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER,
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| REAM |1 HOLE PACKED OFF LOST CIRC, BACK REAM FROM 3207 UP TO 3200' NO
CIRCULATION
18:00 - 22:00 4.00|CIRC |2 LOST CIRC, PACKED OFF, BACK REAM FROM 3207 TO 3179, GOT RETURNS
22:00 - 01:00 3.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD
01:00 - 02:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 3780
02:00 - 04:00 2.00{ REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 3780 TO 3860
04:00 - 05:00 1.00| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, GO THROUGH # 2 PUMP CLEAN OUT ROCKS
05:00 - 05:30 0.50| REAM (1 WASH AND REAM FROM 3860 TO 3870
05:30 - 06:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3870 TO 3875
2/11/2007 | 06:00 - 08:00 2.00{DRL [1 DRILLING FROM 3875' TO 3927
08:00 - 09:30 1.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP # 2
09:30-21:30 | 12.00|DRL  [1 DRILLING FROM 3927' TO 4164’
21:30 - 22:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT TWO SHAKER SCREEN ON ONE ON EACH SHAKER
22:00 - 06:00 8.00[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4164' TO 4280, AT 4242' HOLE STARTED TAKING MUD
AVERAGE 65 BBL / HR. ADDED 20 SKS NEW CARB, 20 SKS MICA, 20 SKS
DYNA FIBER, AND 20 SKS ASH PHALT IN 1 HOUR 15MIN LOSSES WERE
DOWN TO 12 BBLS / HOUR
2/12/2007  06:00 - 09:00 3.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4292' TO 4326'
09:00- 05:00 |  20.00|RIG 2 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION WHILE ATTEMPT TO REPAIRING # 2 MUD PUMP
DISCHARGE, REPAIRS FAILED CHANGED OUT DISCHARGE MODULE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4326' TO 4340'
2/13/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 5.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4340' TO 4379'
11:00 - 12:00 1.00{SUR [1 DROP SURVEY AT 4309' 1.5 DEG 61.20 AZI
12:00 - 19:30 750 TRP |10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE DUE TO PENETRATION RATE
19:30 - 22:00 2.50| OTH PULLED WEAR BUSHING TO CHECK WEAR, DRILL PIPE RIDING ON SIDE OF
BOPS SLIGHT WEAR ON WEAR BUSHING RE RAN WEAR BUSHING
122:00 - 02:30 4.50|{TRP |10 MADE UP BIT # 5 SMITH MX9538 AND TRIP IN HOLE ( 1.5 HOURS TO LATCH
ONTO STAND OF 8" DRILL COLLARS )
02:30 - 04:00 1.50{ RIG 6 SLIPPED AND CUT DRILL LINE
04:00 - 06:00 2.00| OTH ADJUST TOP DRIVE TRACK AND ALINE BOPS WITH ROTARY TABLE
2/14/2007 | 06:00 - 09:00 3.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 4300
09:00 - 10:30 1.50| REAM |1 SAFETY WASH 79' TO BOTTOM 20' OF FILL
10:30 - 14:30 4.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4379 TO 4416
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
15:00 - 17:00 2.00|DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 4416 TO 4431
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, REPLACE SUCTION VALVE AND SEAT IN # 1 PUMP
18:00 - 01:30 7.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4431 TO 4478
01:30 - 05:00 3.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR # 1 PUMP SUCTION VALVE AND SEAT, BULL WHEEL SIDE, ALSO
CHANGED VALVE IN DISCHARGE MIDDLE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4478 TO 4487
2/15/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 DRILLING/ 4487 TO 4500
10:30 - 13:00 2.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT VALVE, SEAT IN # 2PUMP CENTER POT
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER
13:30 - 14:00 0.50|DRL  [1 DRILL F/ 4500 TO 4520
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Sub : g .
Date From - To | Hours | Code |~/ 4e Description of Operations
2/15/2007  |14:00 - 15:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRC, MIX , PUMP SWEEP LMC ( LOST 120 BBL. MUD )
15:00 - 18:00 3.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4520 TO 4584
18:00 - 23:00 5.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/4584 TO 4619
23:00 - 00:00 100|RIG |2 GO THRU #2 MUD PUMP, CHANGE OUT VALVES ON SUCTION AND
DISCHARGE
00:00 - 03:00 3.00|{DRL |1 DRILL F/4619 TO 4641
03:00 - 03:30 0.50|RIG |2 WORK ON #2 PUMP, CHANGE OUT VALVES IN MIDDLE SECTION
03:30 - 06:00 2.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/4641 TO/
2/16/2007 | 06:00 - 10:00 400[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4671' TO/ 4686' (LOST 100 BBLS MUD, DRAIN VALVE TO TRIP TANK
WAS LEFT OPEN)
10:00 - 13:00 3.00| REAM (1 REAMING, WORK TORQUE OUT
13:00 - 16:00 3.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, MiX & PUMP DRY JOB
16:00 - 18:30 250/ TRP |10 T.0.0.H TO HWDP, SLM 4685’
18:30 - 03:30 9.00| ISP 1 INSPECT BHA & LAY DOWN 4 JTS OF 4 1/2" HWDP
03:30 - 06:00 250/ TRP |1 LAY DOWN MOTOR, SHOCK TOOL, IBS STABILIZER, BIT
2/17/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |1 LAY DOWN STABILIZER & MUD MOTOR
07:00 - 08:00 1.00|TRP |1 TRIP IN, PICK UP & REPLACE 4 JTS 4 1/2 HWDP, JARS
08:00 - 12:00 400{TRP |2 TiH
12:00 - 14:00 2.00| REAM 1 WASH & REAM F/3254', T/3515'
14:00 - 15:00 1.00|TRP |2 TH
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/4602 T/ 4685
15:30 - 16:00 0.50|/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4685 T/ 4688
16:00 - 16:30 0.50{CIRC |1 CONDITION & CIRC, PUMP SWEEP
16:30 - 17:30 1.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4688 T/ 4701
17:30 - 18:00 0.50/SUR |1 DEVIATION SURVEY @ 4610’ (1.2 DEVIATION)
18:00 - 18:30 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/4701 T/ 4707
18:30 - 19:00 0.50|CIRC |2 LOST CIRCULATION, 100 BBL LOSS
19:00-06:00 | 11.00{CIRC 1 WORK TIGHT SPOT, CIRC & COND MUD, JARING TIGHT HOLE @ 4693', 14FT
OFF BOTTOM
2/18/2007  |06:00 - 14:00 8.00|FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE @ 4693 UP TO 4672
14:00 - 21:30 750|FISH |4 RIG UP WEATHFORD WIRE LINE TRUCK TO FREE POINT
21:30 - 05:00 7.50|FISH |5 SPOT 300 LBS FRACK SAND IN MUD MOTOR DID NOT WORK SPOTED
300LBS SAND AGAN STILL DID NOT WORK
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE W/ ON STEEL BALL TO LOCK UP MOTOR SO WE
CAN BACK OFF
2/19/2007 | 06:00 - 12:00 6.00[FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE, CAME FREE
12:00 - 13:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT 2 STANDS
13:00 - 14:30 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE, MIX & PUMP PILL, UD FREE POINT CREW
14:30 - 18:00 350|TRP |2 T.0.0.H, L/D DRILLING JARS
18:00 - 20:00 200|TRP |2 T.0.0H
20:00 - 22:00 200/ TRP |1 L/D SHOCK SUB, MOTOR, PDC BIT, MONEL
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| RIG 1 WORK ON TOP DRIVE
23:00 - 00:00 1.00|TRP {1 P/U JUNK BASKET, MILL TOOTH BIT
00:00 - 06:00 6.00[TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
2/20/2007  |08:00 - 07:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH 90’ TO BOTTM 4617 TO 4707
07:00 - 07:30 050|FISH |5 WORK JUNK SUB ON BOTTOM PICK UP BALL , NUTS
07:30 - 08:00 0.50{DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 4707 TO 4718
08:00 - 08:30 050|CIRC |1 CIRC, MIX & PUMP PILL
08:30 - 12:00 350{TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE W/ JUNK SUB ( CLOSED BLIND RAMS, WORKED PIPE RAMS )
12:00 - 12:30 0.50|FISH |5 CLEAN OUT JUNK SUB ( RECOVERED 176 STEEL BALL, 76 1/4, 1/2 NUTS )
12:30 - 15:00 250/ TRP |1 L/D BIT SUB, P/U MUD MOTOR, MONEL DC.
15:00 - 18:30 350|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
118:30 - 19:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM 30' TO BOTTOM, F/4688' T/ 4718'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csouc:)e Description of Operations
2/20/2007 | 19:00 - 21:30 250[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4718 T/4780°
21:30 - 22:30 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE SWAB
22:30 - 00:00 1.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/4780' T/4812'
00:00 - 01:00 1.00{ RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE ANOTHER SWAB
01:00 - 01:30 0.50{DRL |1 DRILL F/4812 T/4831'
01:30 - 02:00 0.50{ RIG 2 COOL #2 MUD PUMP
02:00 - 06:00 4.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/4831° T/4913'
2/21/2007  {06:00 - 14:30 8.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/4913"- T/5045'
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE 1 DISCHARGE & 2 SUCTION
VALVES
15:00 - 16:30 150|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5045' T/5065'
16:30 - 17:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG
17:00 - 19:00 200[DRL |1 DRILL F/5065' T/5071'
19:00 - 19:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, COOL DOWN #1 MUD PUMP MOTOR
19:30 - 21:00 150|DRL |1 DRILL F/5071' T/ 5078, MW 9.7, 47 VIS,
21:00 - 22:30 150|CIRC |1 CIRC & COND MUD, FILL TRIP TANK, MIX & PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY
22:30 - 04:00 550|{TRP |10 P.0.0.H, TRIP OUT FOR BIT
04:00 - 06:00 2.00{TRP |1 L/D & P/UMOTOR & BIT
2/22/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |1 P/U BHA
07:00 - 08:30 1.50| TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
08:30 - 10:00 1.50| RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE
10:00 - 13:00 3.00[TRP {10 TRIP IN HOLE
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH TO 30 'TO BOTTOM ( BLOW BOTTOM OFF GOOD BEFOR DRLG. ) NO
FILL

14:00 - 15:00 1.00({ DRL
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG
15:30 - 00:30 9.00| DRL
00:30 - 02:.00 1.50| RIG
02:00 - 04.00 2.00| DRL
04:00- 04:30 0.50| RIG
04:30 - 06:00 1.50{ DRL
2/23/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50{ DRL
10:30 - 12:00 1.50| RIG
12:00 - 13:30 1.50( DRL
13:30 - 15:00 1.50| RIG
15:00 - 06:00 15.00| DRL
2/24/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00| DRL
10:00 - 10:30 0.50( RIG
10:30 - 11:30 1.00|RIG
11:30 - 16:00 4.50| DRL
16:00 - 16:30 0.50{ CIRC
16:30 - 17.00 0.50| SUR
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| CIRC
17:30 - 23:00 5.50| TRP
23:00 - 00:00 1.00{ TRP
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP
2/25/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| TRP
07:00 - 12:.00 5.00( CIRC

DRILLING F/ 5078 TO 5165 (HELD BOP DRILL 2 MIN,)
RIG SER. & SER. TOP DRIVE, { WORK PIPE RAMS )
DRILLING F/ 5165 TO 5258

RIG REPAIR, WORK ON # RIG PUMP, CHANGE
DRILLING F/5258' T/5323

RIG REPAIR, 1 SUCTION VALVE ON #2 PUMP
DRILLING F/5323' T/5335

DRILLING F/ 5335 TO 5428

TURNED FAN AROUND ON # 1 & # 2 PUMPS
DRILLING F/ 5428 TO 5449

CHANGE SWAB IN # 2 PUMP MIDDLE POT

DRILLI F/ 5449 TO 5570

DRILLING F/ 5570 TO 5609

RIG SER., TOP DRIVE SER.

CHANGE LINER , SWAB IN # 2 PUMP BILL WHEEL SIDE
DRILLING F/ 5609 TO 5627

CIRC COND FOR TRIP

SURVEY @ 5597 .5 DEG 1576 AZ

PUMP PILL, BLOW KELLY OUT

TRIP OUT FOR BIT # 9 ( HAD TRIP BOP DRILL )
CHANGE OUT BITS ( CLOSED BLINDS RAMS, OPEN )
TRIP IN HOLE

TRIP IN HOLE TAGED UP @4785 TITE

WORK TITE HOLE, LOST 130 BBLS MUD, RUN STAND IN 4813

(=]

(=)

12:00 - 17:00 5.00{RIG CHANGE PUMP ON TOP DRIVE
17:00 - 17:30 0.50|{ TRP 0 TRIP IN HOLE

17:30 - 18:00 0.50| REAM WASH 60 ' TO BOTTOM

18:00 - 19:00 1.00| DRL DRILL F/5627 TO 5629

N = = AN = b e e a2 NS aaNaAN2 2NN 2

19:00 - 20:30 1.50|RIG WORK ON # 1PUMP SWAB, #1 CHAGER PUMP SWITCH DOWN
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Sub .
Date From - To | Hours | Code Code Description of Operations
2/25/2007 | 20:30 - 21:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5629 TO 5630
21:00 - 23:00 2.00|RIG 2 CHANGE SEAT #1 PUMP BULL WHEEL SIDE,CHANGE SWAB MIDDLE
23:00 - 02:00 3.00[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5630 TO 5649
02:00 - 03:00 1.00|CIRC |2 LOST CIRC @ 5649 LOST 300 BBLS.
03:00 - 04:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE TIGHT @ 4810
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| REAM {1 BACK REAMING F/ 48 10 TO 4809
2/26/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|CIRC |2 LOST CIRC ( 150 BBLS)
07:00 - 09:00 2.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT 10 STAND COULDN'T CIRC TRIP TO 4750, BACK REAMING TO 4785
09:00 - 10:30 1.50|TRP |2 TRIP BACK IN HOLE
10:30 - 12:30 2.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/5649 TO 5670
12:30 - 13:30 1.00|CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE @ 5670 ON CONN.
13:30 - 23:00 9.50|DRL |1 DRILLING F/5670 TO 5732
23:00 - 00:00 1.00|CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE @ 5732 TO 5642 ( 3 TIMES HOLE GOOD FREE)
00:00 - 06:00 6.00|DRL |1 DRILLING 5732 TO  ( DRILL W/ NO FLUID LOST)
06:00 -
2/27/2007 | 06:00 - 09:00 3.00|DRL |1 DRILLING 5780 TO 5804
09:00 - 15:00 6.00| REAM |1 BACK REAM , JARING UP THROW TIGHT HOLE @ 5803 TO 5700
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT GRABBER DIES IN TOP DRIVE
15:30 - 18:00 250|TRP |2 TRIP QUT HOLE TO 3127 TIGHT
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| REAM |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE F/ 3127 TO 3072 ( 55')
2/28/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00|FISH |3 WORKING TIGHT HOLE JARING UP ( 3272, 3464 PULLED 1 STD TIGHT AGAIN
3400 JARED OUT TO 3369
09:00 - 14:00 5.00|TRP |2 TRIP QUT HOLE
14:00 - 17:00 3.00|TRP |1 L/D BHA. BIT, MM, JARS, AND STAB
17:00 - 22:00 500[TRP |1 TRIP IN HOLE, TIGHT HOLE AT 3257' WORKED PIPE
22:00 - 02:00 4.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND RAISE MUD WEIGHT TO 9.7 AT 3077
02:00 - 03:00 1.00|TRP |1 LOST RETURNS PULLED 2 STANDS
03:00 - 05:30 2.50|CIRC |1 PUMP 2 50 LCM PILL AND CIRC
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| TRP |1 TIH.
3/1/2007 06:00 - 07:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASHING TO BOTTOM LOST CIRC.
08:00 - 08:30 0.50| TRP |2 TRIP OUT 10 STD.
08:30 - 10:00 1.50|CIRC |1 MiX UP LCM PILL, PUMP
10:00 - 14:00 4.00|CIRC |2 CIRC, BUILD MUD VOLUME
14:00 - 15:30 150|TRP |2 TOOH TO 3130' TIGHT HOLE FROM 3250' TO 3130'
15:30 - 19:00 3.50|CIRC |2 CIRC GOOD RETURNS REAM THROUGH TIGHT SPOT, BUILD VOLUME
19:00 - 21:00 2.00|TRP |2 TIH BROKE CIRC EVERY 5 STANDS
21:00 - 06:00 9.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5804’ TO 5889
3/2/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5889' TO 5895'
13:00 - 14:00 1.00|CIRC |1 PUMP PILL, CHANGE PLAN GO BACK TO DRILLING
14:00 - 15:30 1.50|DRL |1 DRILLING NO PROGRESS
15:30 - 18:00 250|DRL |1 MADE AND PUMPED BIT UNBALLING PILL WHILE ATTEMPTING TO DRILL NO
PROGRESS
18:00 - 00:00 6.00| TRP |10 TOOH TIGHT HOLE AT 5800' BACK REAMED THROUGH TIGHT SPOT AND
TOOH NO OTHER PROBLEMS
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP (10 M/U NEW BIT RIH FILLEDPIPE EVERY 6 STANDS AFTER 3200 FOOT
3/3/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE BRAKE CIRC EVERY 5 STAND
07:00 - 08:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM TO 5801'
08:00 - 10:30 2.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMPS # 1 CHANGED OUT SWAB AND SEAT # 2 PUMP
CHANGED OUT SWAB
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| REAM 1 WASH REAM FROM 5801’ TO 5895'
11:00 - 11:30 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMP 40 BBLS OF UNBALLING PILL
11:30 - 12:00 0.50|DRL {1 DRILLING FROM 5895' TO 5901'
|
\
L

Printed: 6/8/2007 2:24:13 PM




Questar E & P Page 8 of 23

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:dbe Description of Operations
3/3/2007 12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR PUMP # 2 CHANGED SWAB
12:30-03:30 | 15.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5801' TO 6014'
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR PUMP #2 CHANGED SWAB
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|{DRL |1 DRILL F/6014' T/ 6041’
3/4/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP # 2 CHANGED SWAB AND VALVE
07:00 - 08:30 150|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6041’ TO 6067*
08:30 - 09:30 1.00| REAM |1 TIGHT HOLE WORK PIPE WASHED AND REAMED TIGHT HOLE AT 6000°
09:30 - 13:00 350[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6067 TO 6107"
13:00 - 14:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
14:00 - 18:30 4.50{TRP (14 SHORT TRIP INTO SHOE, SLM
18:30 - 20:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRLG. LINE
20:00 - 23:30 350|TRP |14 SHORT TRIP TO BOTTOM
23:30 - 02:00 250{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION, MIX PILL FOR DRY JOB, FILL TRIP TANK
02:00 - 02:30 050/SUR |1 DROP SURVEY TOOL, SURVEY @ 6068'
02:30 - 03:00 050[TRP |2 TRIP OUT
03:00 - 04:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR TOP DRIVE HOSE
04:00 - 06:00 200[TRP |2 TRIP OUT
3/5/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00[TRP |2 TOOH, TO RUN 9 5/8 CASING
08:00 - 09:30 150|TRP 11 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE
09:30 - 12:30 3.00(TRP {1 LAYED DOWN 6 5/8 HWDP, 8 " DRILL COLLARS MONEL, AND MOTOR
RETRIVED SURVEY DEPTH 6068 DEG. .9 AZI 149
12:30 - 13:30 1.00| OTH RETRIVED, WEAR BUSHING
13:30 - 15:00 150|CcsG |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIGGING UP CASING CREW, FILL UP TOOL, AND
STABING BOARD
15:00-03:00 | 12.00|CSG |2 RUN 140 JTS, 9 5/8 CASING 47#FT, HCP-110, LT&C
03:00 - 03:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION, LOST CIRCULATION @ 3300, 55 STKS 194GPM,
MW-9.8, VIS 43, 7% LCM
03:30 - 04:30 1.00{CMT |1 R/U HALLIBURTON TO CEMENT, SAFETY MEETING
04:30 - 06:00 1.50{CMT |2 CEMENTING 9 5/8 CASING
3/6/2007 06:00 - 09:30 350{CMT |2 CEMENTING
LEAD- 842 SK, CBM- LIGHT, 10.5 PPG, YIELD 4.14, F/ 3000' T/5100'
TAIL- 585 SK, 50- 50 POZ, 14.35 PPG, YIELD 1.25, F/5100° T/ 6100°
BUMPED PLUG- @ 9AM 3-5-07, FLOAT HELD @ 3000PSI, RELEASED
PRESSURE
09:30 - 10:00 0.50{BOP |1 FINISH N/D BOP AND FLOW LINE
10:00 - 12:00 200{csG |7 SET SLIPS, CAMERON ROUGH CUT CASING, SET @ 280K
12:00 - 14:00 2.00{BOP |1 4 BOLT BOP TO L/D DRILL PIPE
14:00 - 15:00 1.00/CSG |1 L/D & CHANGE OUT ELEVATORS & BAILS
15:00 - 18:00 3.00{TRP |2 TRIP IN TO L/D DRILL PIPE, INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
18:00 - 20:00 2.00[TRP |3 R/U L/D MACHINE & LAY DOWN PIPE
20:00 - 21:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
21:30 - 01:30 4.00|TRP |3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, RIG DOWN L/D TRUCK
01:30 - 06:00 450|BOP |1 N/D BOP
3/7/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00/BOP |1 FINISH NIPPLE DOWN STACK
07:00-18:00 | 11.00/LOC |7 FINISH CLEANING PITS, LAY DOWN TESCO TOP DRIVE, INSTALL B SECTION
& NITE CAP, LOADING QUT RENTALS
3/8/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 CLEAN TANKS,RIG DOWN & LOAD OUT TOP DRIVE & RENTALS
3/9/2007 07:00-18:00 | 11.00/LOC |4 LOAD OUT RENTALS, INSPECTING DRILL PIPE
3/10/2007  |07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |4 INSPECTING DRILL PIPE 233 JTS.
3/11/2007  |07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |4 PREPARING TO MOVE, FINISH INSPECTING DRILL PIPE 349 JTS. 3 BENT JTS.
3/12/2007  |08:00-18:00 | 10.00{LOC {4 LAY DERRICK DOWN, LOAD OUT 7 TRUCKS
4/1/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 ENSIGN 24-RIG DOWN AND MOVE CAMPS TO LOCATION/RIG UP SAME,
HAUL TUBULARS IN, OTHER LOCATION 60% RIGGED DOWN AND 40% OFF
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSc;Jdbe Description of Operations
4/1/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |3 LOCATION (BACK YARD IS MOVED OUT)/HARD BANDING BHA/HAVE 4 LOADS
OF TUBULARS STILL ON OLD LOCATION.
18:00- 06:00 |  12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
4/2/2007 06:00- 18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 RIG DOWN DERRICK, SUB, MOTOR PACKAGE, 100% RIGGED DOWN AND

100% OFF OLD LOCATION, SET MATTING BOARDS AND BOTTOM SUB, ALL 6"
BHA IS HARD BANDED, (RING GROOVE ON SINGLE GATE HAS STUD
MARKINGS-FLARED OUT)Y MONTORING BACK SIDE-GAINING250 EVERY
HALF HOUR AND BLEEDING IT OFF.

18:00 - 06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

4/3/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |4 SET IN SUBS, MOTOR PACKAGE, MUD TANKS, PUMPS, HOPPER HOUSE,
PUT DERRICK TOGETHER, LIGHT PLANT, MUD CLEANING EQUIPMENT, BAR
HOPPERS, PREMIX TANK 80% SET IN 25% RIGGED UP, BLEEDING
PRESSURE OFF OF LAST WELL EVERY HALF HOUR UNTIL 1900-LETTING
PRESSURE BUILD WHILE MONITORING.NOT TO EXCEED 5,000 PS}
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| OTH WAIT ON DAY LIGHT/ LETTING WELL BUILD UP PRESSURE

41412007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 GET DERRICK READY AND PUT ON FLOOR, PUT COMPOUND TOGHETHER,
SET IN GAS BUSTER LINES/EQUIPMENT, DIESEL TANKS, FIRE LIGHT PLANT,
WELD HOLES IN MUD TANKS (BAD SHAPE), STRING CORDS, HOOKING UP
LINES/PUMP SHED AND BACK YARD. STRING UP DERRICK (LOAED OUT 105
JT'S DRILL PIPE 4" XT 39 TO RIG 236)

WAIT ON DAY LIGHT

BROKE TOUR TODAY, INSPECT DERRICK TO RAISE AND RAISE DERRICK,
RIG UP FLOOR TUGGER AND INSTAL HAND RAILS, UNBRIDLE, LAY DOWN
PART OF TRACK THAT WAS BENT FROM LAST WELL,SET IN YELLOW DOG,
FILL PITS WITH WATER, CHANGING OIL IN MUD PUMP, HOOK UP STAND
PIPE, THERE WAS HANDS STANDING AROUND WATCHING OTHER HANDS
ON A JOB THAT SHOULD ONLY TAKE TWO HANDS TO DO. GOT WITH
PUSHER AND TOLD HIM THAT HE NEED TO SEPARATE HANDS, ONTO
DIFFERENT TASK'S. SO HE STARTED SEPARATING THE HANDS AND
PUTTING THEM ON DIFFERNT TASK'S.

18:00-06:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 RIG UP WET SYSTEM ON BAR HOPPER'S HOOK UP CHOKE LINE, KILL LINE,
CHANGE SWABS,LINERS (SHORT TWO BE HERE THIS AM) RIG UP RETURN
LINE ON GAS BUSTER, DRESS SHAKER'S, PUT CULVERT IN FOR MOUSE
HOLE

4/6/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 STACK ANNULAR, ROTATING HEAD, CHANGE LINERS/CHANGED PONY ROD
SEAL'S IN #1 PUMP, PICK UP TOP DRIVE RAIL AND CENTER RAIL TIGHTEN
TURN BUCKLES,INSTALL LANDING AROUND BOPE,PUT IN MOUSE
HOLES-HAD PROBLEMS GETTING THE FRONT ONE IN BUT MANAGED
TO,(NOTIFIED STONY WITH BLM THAT WE'LL BE TESTING IN THE NEXT
24HR.S), PICK UP SWIVEL, BIULT TROUGH ON BACK SIDE OF PITS TO
DIVERT FLUID TO RESERVE PIT.

18:00-06:00 | 12.00{LOC |4 PICK UP NEW TOP DRIVE (OLD ONE UP FOR SERVICE) HOOK UP TORQUE
TUBE GUIDE (DON'T HAVE THE RIGHT CONNECTION BETWEEN SWIVEL AND
TOP DRIVE (TOP DRIVE HAS NC 61 THREAD INSTEAD OF A 6 5/8 REG) RUN
TOP DRIVE HOSES FIRE UP UNIT AND HOSES LEAKING EVERY WHERE IN
NEW TOP DRIVE (NEW TOP DRIVE HAND FIRST TIME RIGGING UP BY HIM
SELF-LITTLE LOST), FINALY FINISHED LINERS IN PUMPS, FLOW LINE OFF 5"
(WELDER ON HIS WAY),

18:00 - 06:00 12.00(LOC
4/5/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00({LOC

Y

41712007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00{LOC 4 CHANGED VALVE IN FLOW LINE, WELD FLOW LINE,LAY OUT AND MAKE UP
FLARE LINES, WORK ON SMALL LEAK'S IN GUN LINES READY TO PRESSURE
TEST @ 900AM
09:00 - 06:00 21.00{OTH WORKING ON TOP DRIVE (NEW HAND THAT IT WAS HIS FIRST TIME

RIGGING UP TOP DRIVE PRESSURED UP UNIT AND BLEW OIL ALL OVER
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code (:S:dbe Description of Operations
41712007 09:00-06:00 | 21.00| OTH DIDN'T KNOW WHAT WAS WRONG, JOHN THE HAND THATS BEEN SITTING
ON THIS RIG SHOWED UP TODAY AND SUPT. BILL AND ANOTHER HAND.
THEY TESTED LINES AND FOUND CHECK VALVE BAD AND SEALS BLOWN IN
TOP DRIVE, PULL MOTORS AND REPLACE SEALS
4/8/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00| OTH WORK ON TOP DRIVE, FINISH PUTTING IN MOTOR AND TEST LINES AND
OPERATIONS OF UNIT ALL WORKING CORRECTLY (TORQUE ALL
CONNECTION'S)
10:00 - 14:00 4.00|BOP |1 IPS TIGHTENED CONNECTIONS ON BOPE
14:00-00:00 | 10.00|BOP |2 RIG UP AND PRESSURE TEST TOP DRIVE DOUBLE BALL VALVE DIDN'T TEST
CHANGED DOUBLE BALL VALVE AND IT DIDN'T TEST,TEST THIRD VALVE
TEST TIW, DART VALVE, BLIND, UPPER AND LOWER PIPES, CHOKE
MANIFOLD AND HCR 10 MIN LOW 250 PSI HIGH 10,000 PSI ANNULAR 10 MIN
LOW 250 PS! HIGH 5000 PSI,BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY MESSAGE ON PHONE
(BLM WAS NOT PRESENT FOR TEST) WHILE TESTING MUDDING UP
SURFACE SYSTEM
00:00 - 05:00 5.00| RIG 2 CLEAN RIG FLOOR OF OIL AND REPLACE DRIVE CHAIN ON DRAWWORKS
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING/ WHEN ISTALLING DRILLER TOLD MOTOR HAND
TO MAKE SURE KOOMY LEVERS WHERE IN THE OPEN POSTION, BUT THE
HCR, WHEN | DISCOVERED THE PROBLEM ALL KOOMY LEVERS WHERE IN
THE OPEN POSTION BUT THE ANNULAR IT WAS SHUT
4/9/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING, COULDN'T COME OUT OF THE HOLE WITH WEAR
BUSHING, LOOK OVER EQUIPMENT AND HYDRILL WAS SHUT, DRILLER
TOLD HAND TO OPEN EVERY THING BUT TO SHUT HCR VALVE, HE SHUT
THE WRONG VALVE, | DISCUSSED WITH DRILLER AND HANDS NOT TO BE
OPERATING FUNTIONS WHILE INSTALLING WEAR BUSHING.
07:00 - 08:00 1.00|TRP |1 RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK, TO PICK UP DRILL PIPE
08:00 - 08:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE MAKE UP SIDE CABLE, BROKE WHEN MAKING UP BIT
08:30 - 15:00 6.50| TRP |1 RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE AND PICK UP BHA AND 3260’ OF 5" DRILL PIPE,
TAGGED EARLY AT 44607 THAT IS 1539' ABOVE THE FLOAT SHOE
15:00 - 16:00 100|{csG |1 RIG DOWN LAY DOWN TRUCK
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| OTH FILE UNION STARTER THREAD (IT CAME FROM THE REPAIR SHOP WITH
OUT ANY PROTECTION ON IT) AND PICK UP KELLY HOSE AND PUT ON
SWIVEL
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| RIG 2 WORK ON AIR LINES BETWEEN MOTOR SHED'S/ SOME CROSSED LINES
WHEN #3 MOTOR CLUTCH KICKS IN #2 PUMP COMES ON LINE/ WHEN KICK
IN #2 PUMP ENGINE'S THOTTLE UP
18:30 - 19:30 1.00[CIRC |1 FILL PIPE PRESSURED UP AND NO CIRCULATION
19:30 - 22:00 250|TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE (WET)
22:00 - 23:30 1.50| OTH CLEAN RIG FLOOR AFTER WET TRIP AND DRIED MUD FROM DRILL PIPE
PACK OFF ON TOP OF MUD MOTOR AND FIRST IBS, BREAK BIT AND CLEAN
OUT PLUG JETS (PLUGGED WITH CEMENT)
23:30 - 00:00 0.50| TRP |2 TRIP IN FIRST STAND AND STAND WITH X-OVER AND PUMP TO SEE IF
MOTOR WAS CLEAN (MOTOR WAS GOOD)
00:00 - 01:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP INTO HOLE TO DRILL OUT CEMENT, BREAK CIRC AFTER BHA
01:30 - 02:00 0.50| OTH CHANGE GRABBER DIES IN TOP DRIVE
02:00 - 03:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP IN 3 ROWS
03:00 - 04:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
04:00 - 04:30 0.50| RIG 2 WORK ON SWIVEL PACKING (LEAKING HAD TO HAMMER UP)
04:30 - 05:00 0.50|CIRC |1 BREAK CIRCULATION
05:00 - 05:30 0.50| TRP |2 TRIP IN 3 STANDS
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASHING AND REAMING CEMENT IN CASING FROM 4460 TO 4501
4/10/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 4.00| REAM |1 DRILLING CEMENT FROM 4,501 TO 5251 (CEMENT WIPER PLUG WAS @4540)
CEMENT COMING OVER SHAKERS CLUMPY 1/2-1" CHUNKS (HARD)
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:é’e Description of Operations
4/10/2007  {10:00 - 11:00 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE GREASE TOP DRIVE AND DRAW TOOL, COMPOUND
11:00 - 20:00 9.00| OTH DRILL CEMENT FROM 5251 TO 6120 @ 5715 SANDY CEMENT STARTED
COMING OVER SHAKERS (SOFT)
20:00 - 20:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN FOR FIT TEST
20:30 - 21:00 0.50| OTH PERFORM FIT WITH 8.8 MUD WT 850 PSI = EQUIV. 11.5 MUD WT WITHB & C
QUICK TEST
21:00 - 01:00 4.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6120 TO 6241 (ROP 30.25)
01:00 - 02:30 1.50| RIG 2 WORK ON #1- ROD CLAMP AND #2 PUMP- COULDN'T GET TO PUMP AIRED
UP/ WENT THROUGH PUMP TO SEE IF THERE WAS SOMING UNDER VALVE
COULDN'T FIND ANYTHING
02:30 - 06:00 350{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6241 TO 6295 (ROP 15.4)
4/11/2007 | 06:00 - 14:30 850{DRL |1 DRILL FROM 6295 TO 6474 (ROP 21' HR.) (10-15 WOB, 50 TABLE, PUMPING
BIT UNBALLING SWEEP'S WHEN NEEDED AND TRICKLE NUT SHELL OVER
SUCTION IN TANK, ALSO ON CONNECTIONS DROPPING SOAP STICKS AND
SAPP/ SOFT GUMMY CLAY COMING OVER SHAKERS)
14:30 - 15:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG
15:30-06:00 | 14.50|/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 6474 TO 6775 (ROP 20.75' HR)
4/12/2007 | 06:00 - 09:30 350/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6775 - 6850', 75', 21.42 FPH, 19K WOB, 92 RPM DOWM HOLE,
50 RPM ON SURFACE. HELD STAND DOWN SAFETY MEETING ON 3
ACCIDENTS ON QEP LOCATIONS.
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION LOWER PIPE RAMS
110:30 - 14:30 4.00[DRL |1 DRILL 6850' - 6945', 95', 23.75 FPH, 19K WOB, 92 RPM DH, 50 RPM ON
SURFACE. PUMPING LCM & BIT BALLNG SWEEPS AS NEEDED. CEMENTED
BASE PLATE ON WELL HEAD W/ 5 YDS OF REDIMIX FROM PETE MARTIN.
14:30 - 15:30 1.00|SUR |1 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 6874, .5 DEG. @ 1474
15:30-06:00 | 14.50/DRL |1 DRILL 6945' - 7351°, 406", 28 FPH, WOB 15-20K, 92 RPM DOWN HOLE, 50 RPM
ON SURFACE, STILL PUMPING LCM & BIT BALLING SWEEPS AS NEEDED.
TOTAL LOSSES TODAY 200 BBL.
4/13/2007  |06:00 - 12:00 6.00/DRL |1 DRILL 7351 - 7508', 157", 26.16 FPH, WOB 15-20K, 92 RPM DOWN HOLE, 50
RPM ON MOTOR. SLIGHT BIT BALLING, NO NOTICEABLE LOSSES SO FAR
TODAY.
12:00 - 13:00 1.00{SUR |1 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 7438', .6 DEG. 202.
13:00 - 16:30 350{DRL |1 DRILL 7508' - 7603', 95', 27.14 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWN HOLE.
16:30 - 17:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
17:30-06:00 | 12.50|DRL |1 DRILL 7603 - 7905', 302", 24.16 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWN HOLE. TOTAL LOSSES TODAY 125 BBL. SLIGHT SEEPAGE HOLE IN
GOOD CONDITION. ONLY SMALL SLOUGH & VERY LITTLE OF THAT.
4/14/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00|DRL |1 DRILL 7905' - 7983, 78', 26 FPH. WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE & 91
DOWN HOLE. MINIMAL SEEPAGE, NO INCREASE IN SLOUGH.
09:00 - 10:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
10:00 - 15:00 500|DRL |1 DRILL 7983 - 8076', 93", 18.6 FPH, WOB 15-21K, RPM 50 ON SURFACE, 91
DOWN HOLE. TOTAL LOSSES TO TRIP = 185 BBL, SEEPAGE & DUMPING
SAND TRAPS.
15:00 - 19:30 450|TRP |10 PUMP PILL & TOH W/ BIT #13.
19:30 - 20:30 1.00|TRP |10 BREAK OFF BIT, PU NEW BIT, FUNCTION BLIND RAMS
20:30 - 00:00 3.50|TRP |10 TIH W/ BIT #14, CHANGE OUT CORROSION RING. GOOD TRIP.
00:00 - 00:30 0.50| REAM (1 W&R 90' TO BOTTOM, 10' OF FILL, LOST 30 BBL ON TRIP. 10 BBL OF IT WET
PIPE.
00:30 - 06:00 550(DRL |1 DRILL 8076 - 8280', 204", 37.09 FPH, WOB 11-15K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWN HOLE. VERY SLIGHT SEEPAGE.
4/15/2007 | 06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 DRILL 8280 - 8453, 173", 38.44 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE &
91 DOWN HOLE, NO NOTICEABLE LOSSES AS OF YET. VERY LITTLE
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csc:jdbe Description of Operations
4/15/2007 | 06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 SLOUGH.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE. FUNCTION LOWER PIPE RAMS.
11:30-06:00 | 1850|DRL |1 DRILL 8453’ - 8818', 365", 19.72 FPH, WOB 15-20k, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,

91 DOWN HOLE. PUMPING BIT BALLING SWEEPS @ 1/2 - 1 HR INTERVALS
SOME TIMES IT HELPS BUT ONLY FOR 3-4. VERY SLIGHT SEEPAGE LAST 24
HRS.

4/16/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00| DRL 1 DRILL 8818' - 8932', 114', 28.5 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWNHOLE. STILL PUMPING BIT BALLING SWEEPS @ 1/2 - 1 HR
INTREVALS. SEEPAGE MINIMAL

10:00 - 11:00 1.00{ RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION ANNULAR & CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC

11:00 - 06:00 19.00| DRL 1 DRILL 8932' - 9511', 579", 30.47 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,
100 DOWN HOLE INCREASED PUMPS TO 418 GPM. VERY SLIGHT SEEPAGE.

4/17/12007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL 9511' - 9608', 97", 27.71 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,

100 DOWN HOLE. BIT JUST KEEPS HANGING IN. SEEPAGE MINIMAL.

09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE FILTER ON CHAIN OILER ON COMPOUND.

10:00 - 12:30 2.50| DRL 1 DRILL 9608' - 9704, 96", 38.4 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURVACE,100
DOWN HOLE

12:30 - 13:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, ADJUST BRAKES, ADD SAFETY CHAINS TO BALE
EXTENSION, & FUNCTION LOWER PIPE RAMS.

13:30 - 06.00 16.50( DRL 1 DRILL 9704' - 10200, 496', 30.06 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,

100 DOWN HOLE. HOLE TAKING A LITTLE MORE FLUID THE LAST 3 HRS,
ABOUT 10 BBL. PUMPED 10% LCM SWEEP, STILL PUMPING BIT BALLING
SWEEP EVERY HALF HR SINCE 22:00. FIRST TIGHT CONN @ 10181 ABOUT
25K OVER. REAMED BACK THROUGH IT AND DIDN'T SEE IT.

4/18/2007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL 10200 - 10342', 142", 40.6 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,
100 DOWN HOLE, TRIPPING BIT ON HOURS ONLY.
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| CIRC 1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP.
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 DROP SURVEY @ 10362 .6 202, SAME AS LAST SURVEY. DRILLER CHECKED

SURVEY. WHEN | CHECKED IT IT WAS 89.6 @ 68.9, POSSIBLE MIS-RUN. 1
THINK IT TOOK A SURVEY ON THE BENCH, BUT CAN'T TELL FOR SURE.
11:00 - 18:00 7.00| TRP 10 PUMP PILL, TOH W/ BIT #14, PULL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER, BREAK OFF
BIT, LD MUD MOTOR.

18:00 - 19:00 1.00( TRP 10 PU NEW BIT # 15, NEW MOTOR, & TIH TO JARS. JARS HAD TOP SEAL OUT OF
MANDREL, LD JARS. #1 4/17/07

19:00 - 20:00 1.00| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE, 180

20:00 - 21:00 1.00{ RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, TOP DRIVE, & FUNCTION ANNULAR

21:00 - 22:00 1.00{ WOT 5 WO, STRAP & PU JARS. #2 4/17/07

22:00 - 03:30 5.50| TRP 10 TiH, BREAK CIRC AT BHA, & EA. 3 ROWS TO BOTTOM 1 STAND OFF BOTTOM
TIGHT, PACKED OFF.

03:30 - 05:00 1.50| FISH 6 WORK TIGHT HOLE, SET OFF JARS 3 TIMES EASY, FOUND FREE SPOT,
BREAK CRC. BACK REAM OUT TO 10208'
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{ REAM |1 W&R 10208' - 10300
4/19/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 REAM |1 WA&R 10300' - 10342, 36' OF FILL,LOTS OF PRESSURED SLOUGH BUT
NOTHING LARGE.
07:00 - 12:00 5.00| DRL 1 DRILL 10342’ - 10541, 199", 39.8 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 124, 65 ON SURFACE,

59 DOWN HOLE. NO NOTICABLE SEEPAGE TO THIS POINT. BOP DRILL.
SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS

DRILL 10541' - 11060, 519", 30.52 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 110, 50 ON
SURFACE, 60 DOWN HOLE, NO NOTICEABLE SEEPAGE LAST 24
HRS.PUMPING BIT BALLING SWEEPS IN SLOW DRILLING SPOTS.
4/20/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50| DRL 1 DRILL 11060" - 11207', 147", 32.66 FPH, WOB 15 - 20K, RPM 110, 50 ON
SURFACE, 60 DOWN HOLE, NO NOTICEABLE SEEPAGE TO THIS POINT.

12:00 - 13:00 1.00| RIG
13:00 - DRL

- =
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Sub . ;
Date From - To | Hours | Code Code Description of Operations
4/20/2007  |10:30 - 11:30 1.00{RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION ANNULAR, ADJUST BRAKES.
11:30 - 14:00 250|DRL  [1 DRILL 10207 - 11301', 94, 37.6 FPH, WOB 15-20, RPM 100, 50 ON SURFACE,
60 DOWN HOLE, TOP DRIVE WILL NOT TURN OVER 50 RPM ON SURFACE. IT
WILL TURN 70 OFF BOTTOM BUT FALLS TO 50 WHEN YOU PUT IT ON
BOTTOM.
14:00 - 18:00 4.00|RIG 8 REPLACE AIR VALVE & LINDE PUMP ON TOP DRIVE.
18:00-05:00 | 11.00[DRL |1 DRILL 11301’ - 11488, 187, 17 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 120, 80 DOWN HOLE, 60
ON SURFACE. HOLE STARTED TAKING FLIUD @ 11380, SHOW 11382 - 11400’
600u, 6637u, 3800u. TRIED TO GO THROUGH BUSTER BUT ROTATING HEAD
LEAKING BAD.
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{RIG 4 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD, SEAL GONE WHEN WE PULLED HEAD,
DON'T THINK ONE WAS INSTALLED AFTER LAST TRIP.
4/21/2007 | 06:00 - 09:00 3.00{DRL |1 DRILL 11488’ - 11561", 73, 24.33 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 119, 60 ON SURFACE,
59 DOWN HOLE. ROTATIG HEAD LOCKED UP, WORE RUBBER OUT.
09:00 - 10:00 1.00| RIG 4 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD RUBBERS.
10:00 - 13:00 3.00{DRL |1 DRILL 11561’ - 11614', 53, 17.66 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 119, 60 ON
SURFACE, 59 DOWN HOLE. LOSSES SEEM TO BE SLOWING.
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE.
14:00-00:30 | 1050/ DRL |1 DRILL 11614' - 11724 110',10.47 FPH, WOB 20-25K, RPM 119, 60 ON SURFACE,
59 DOWN HOLE. LOOSING ABOUT 2-4 BBL HR OF FLUID, RAISING MW TO
CONTROL GAS, DRILLING FLARE 15-25', CONN FLARE 35'
00:30 - 06:00 5.50|CIRC |1 DRILLING SLOWED TO 4 FPH, SHUT DOWN TO RAISE MW F/ BIT TRIP. BBG
THROUGH BUSTER 1500 - 2500u MW 10.2, HEADED F/ 10.4. BYPASSED
SHAKERS TO KEEP LCM IN SYSTEM.
4/22/2007  |06:00-23:30 | 17.50{CIRC |1 C&C F/ BIT TRIP. MW HEADED F/ 10.2 - 10.8. GAS @ 10.8 IS STILL 725u
THROUGH THE BUSTER, SPOTTED 160 BBL OF 12.2PPG MUD ON BOTTOM.
ESTIMATE TOP OF PILL @ 9981'
23:30 - 01:00 1.50[TRP |10 TOH 22 STANDS SLOW & WET. TO 9653', GAINED 8 BBL OF FLUID PULLING 22
STANDS.
01:00 - 04:00 3.00{CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP TO CLEAN UP GAS. GAS ON BUSTER 650u. MIXED PILL
WHILE CIRC.
04:00 - 06:00 2.00[CIRC |1 CHECK F/ FLOW, FLOWING 1/2" STREAM, RAISING MW TO 11.0 PPG.
4/23/2007  |06:00-00:00 | 18.00{CIRC |1 C&C, RAISING MW F/ 10.8 - 11.8, HAD 11.7 COMMING BACK & LOST
COMPLETE RETURNS @ 23:49 LCM 12%
00:00 - 01:00 1.00[CIRC |2 MIXING LCM & MUD, LETTING MW DROP BACK TO 11.7 BRINGING LCM TO
15%
01:00 - 06:00 5.00|CIRC |1 C&C, BUILD VOLUME, WT @ 11.7, LCM @ 20%, LOSSES @ 17 BPH, SEEM TO
BE SLOWING A LITTLE, AROUND 7 BPH AS NEAR AS | CAN TELL AT THIS
TIME.
4/24/2007  |06:00 - 13:30 7.50|CIRC |1 C&C, MIXING MUD & BUILD VOLUME. CHECKED FLOW @ 08:00, NO FLOW.
C&C BUILD PREMIX, GUN LINES PLUGGED OFF, & BAR HOPPER @ PREMIX
PLUGGING @ 4X3" SAWGE. CHECKED F/ FLOW @ 11:15, FLOWING 1*
STREAM & SURGING TO 4" -6" STREAM FIRST TIME WE HAVE SEEN THIS
SURGING. TAKING PREMIX TO 12.2 PPG W/ 30% LCM.
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION HCR VALVE, CHECK FLOW, NO
FLOW. 11.8PPG MW.
14:00 - 18:00 4.00[CIRC |1 C&C, BUILD PREMIX, 12.2 PPG MW, 30% LCM & SPOT F/ 9653 - 6745'
CALCULATED OH.
18:00 - 03:30 9.50| TRP {10 TOH TO 6107, PUMP TRIP PILL. CONTINUE W/ SLOW TOH, LD BIT & MOTOR.
NO LOSSES ON TOH.
03:30 - 06:00 2.50|TRP |10 PU HUNTING .22 MOTOR SN 6142, DOG SUB, HTC 406Z BIT SN 7301750 BIT
#16, & TIH SLOW
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Sub i g :
Date From - To | Hours | Code Code Description of Operations
4/25/2007 | 06:00 - 08:30 250|TRP {10  |TIH SLOW,BREAK CIRC EVERY 3 ROWS TO SHOE
08:30 - 09:00 0.50|TRP |10 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD
09:00 - 10:00 1.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @ THE SHOE, GAS PEAKED @ 4899, 10-15'
FLARE.
10:00 - 16:00 6.00/TRP {10  |TIH CIRCULATING BOTTOMS UP EVERY ROW , BOTTOMS UP FLARE ON
LAST ROW 40 + 44 BBL GAIN.
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| REAM |1 W&R 470' TO BOTTOM, 36' OF FILL BOTTOMS UP FLARE 50", GAINED 55 BBL.
17:00 - 18:00 1.00[CIRC {1 CIRC OUT GAS.
18:00-06:00 | 12.00(DRL |1 DRILL 11724’ - 11839, 115, WOB 18-25K, RPM 142, 92 DOWN HOLE, 50 ON
SURFACE NO LOSSES THIS MORNING. MW 12.0, LCM 25% STILL BY PASSING
SHAKERS.
4/26/2007  |06:00 - 12:30 6.50|DRL |1 DRILL 11839’ - 11867", 28',4.3 FPH, WOB 25K, RPM 142, 92 DOWN HOLE, 50 ON
SURFACE. PLAYED W/ RPM 8 WOB BUT THATS ALL WE COULD GET OUT OF
THIS BIT.
12:30 - 13:30 1.00[SUR |1 DROP SURVEY @ 11797 (MISS RUN)
13:30 - 14:30 1.00[CIRC {1 CIRC & FINISH MIXING TRIP PILL.
14:30 - 18:00 350/ TRP |10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE SLOW
18:00 - 21:00 3.00|TRP |1 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
21:00 - 21:30 0.50|TRP {1 CHANGE OUT BIT'S/ RETREIVE SURVEY/ FUNTION TEST BLINDS AND PIPE
RAMS
21:30 - 02:00 450|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE, FILL EVERY 3 ROWS, INSTALL ROT. RUBBER
02:00 - 02:30 0.50[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @ SHOE 110 PEAK GAS
02:30 - 05:30 3.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE FILL PIPE AND BREAK CIRCULATION 8785,10,794
05:30 - 06:00 0.50[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE/ WASH @ 10,794
4/27/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 11744
07:00 - 08:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 11,744 TO 11,867 25 FT FILL
08:00 - 13:00 5.00/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 11,867 TO 11,924 (ROP 11.4) (STARTED SHAKING OUT LCM
SLOWLY OVER 1 SHAKER @ 10:30 am) MW 11.7/GAS 180 UNIT'S/ ON
CONNECTION WORKED THROUGH TIGHT SPOT @ 11,890 UP TO 11,870
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE (SERVICE TOP DRIVE, COMPOUND)
14:00 - 18:00 4.00|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 11,924 TO 11,965 (ROP 10.25 FT HR)
18:00-06:00 | 12.00|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 11,965 TO 12,076 (ROP 9.25 FT HR) SLOWWED TO 4-5 FT HR
FROM 11,975-12,003
4/28/2007  |06:00 - 13:00 7.00/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,076 TO 12,209 (ROP 19 FT HR) SHAKING LCM OUT DOWN TO
8-10% WOB 10-15, DHRPM 142, STARTED SEEPING WHEN WT UP TO 11.7+,
13:00 - 14:00 1.00{ RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, TOP DRIVE, (REPLACE QUIK RELEASE ON #1 MOTOR
CLUTCH)
14:00 - 18:30 450{DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,209 TO 12,256 (ROP 10.4 FT HR) HIT BLACK HAWK SAND
TOOK KICK
18:30 - 02:30 8.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE THROUGH CHOKE WEIGHTING UP MUD SLOWLY 1-2 POINTS A
CIRCULATION NOT WANTING TO KNOCK THE BOTTOM OUT/ BRING UP LCM
TO 20%-25%
02:30 - 06:00 3.50|CIRC |2 STARTED LOSSING CIRCULATION WHEN MUD WEIGHT REACHED 12.3
PPG,SLOWWED PUMP DOWN AND PUMP HI LCM SWEEP,
4/29/2007  |06:00-02:30 | 20.50|CIRC |2 FIGHT LOST CIRCULATION, PIPES SHUTIN AND GAS SOMETIMES OVER 3000
UNIT'S, PUMPING LCM SWEEPS EVERY HALF HOUR AND BRINGING MUD
WEIGHT UP 1 POINT PER CIRCULATION WHILE GOING THROUGH CHOKE,
02:30 - 06:00 3.50|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,256 TO 12,285 (ROP 8.25 FT HR) BRING WT UP TO CONTROL
BACK GROUND GAS
4/30/2007  |06:00 - 08:00 2.00|DRL 11 DRILL FROM 12,285 TO 12,303 (ROP 9 FT HR.) 2-3 BBL LOSS 25-28% LCM,
08:00 - 09:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE, COMPOUND, BLOCKS
09:00-06:00 | 21.00/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,303 TO 12,471' (ROP 8' FT. HR. ) 2-3 BBLS LOSS
5/1/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,470 TO 12,490 (ROP 10" HR) MW 12.7/WOB 20-25/ DHRPM 130
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code C:S(;Jdbe Description of Operations
5/1/2007 06:00 - 08:00 200/DRL |1 SHAKE LCM OUT TO 10% LCM IN SYSTEM
08:00-21:00 | 13.00|RIG 2 REPAIR RIG/MASTER CLUTCH BOOT HAS HOLE IN [T, (NEW ONE COMING
FROM CASPER AND TWO MECHANICS)
21:00 - 06:00 9.00{DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,490 TO 12,600 ( ROP 12.2 HR ) MW 12.7/WOB 20-25/DHRPM
130
5/2/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,600 TO 12,612 (ROP 4.8 FT HR)
08:30 - 10:30 200[CIRC |7 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP FOR SAMPLE/MUD LOGGER
10:30 - 17:00 6.50| RIG 2 SHORT TRIP OUT 50 STANDS SLOW BECAUSE OF AIR ISSUES WITH
MASTER CLUTCH (WHEN THEY THROTTLE UP ON DRAWWORKS ABOUT
HALF THROTTLE IT KICK'S OUT THE MASTER CLUCH), (TIGHT SPOTS WERE
AT 12,225 TO 12,12,215 AND 11,960 TO 11,950 AND 11,925 TO 11,910) WORK
UP AND DOWN THROUGH TIGHT SPOTS/ WHILE TRIPPING ALSO WAS
TRYING TO WORK ON MASTER CLUTCH TO FIGURE OUT PROBLEM WITH IT,
117:00 - 21:00 4.00|TRP |14 TRIP IN HOLE 50 STANDS BREAKING CIRCULATION EVERY 22 JT.S/ WASHED
25' OF SOFT FILL(MOTOR IS REAL WEAK)
21:00 - 02:30 550|CIRC {1 CIRCULATE AND GET MUD PROPERIES INTO SHAPE(12.7+) BOTTOMS UP
FLARE 25'-30"/PIT GAIN 86 BBL.S/ WITH ECD.S FLARE IS 2-3'
02:30 - 03:30 1.00{CIRC |1 FLOW CHECK - OK - DROP SURVEY
03:30 - 06:00 250|TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN 7* LINER & STRAP OUT OF HOLE
5/3/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| TRP |2 TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING LINER STRAPPING OUT OF HOLE(
SLM-12,604/ NO CORRECTION) (TRIPPING SLOW BECAUSE OF MASTER
CLUTCH TROUBLE ON RIG)
12:30 - 17:30 500|TRP |1 RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK AND LAY DOWN BHA (WET)
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
18:00 - 19:30 150{CcsG |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING/RIG UP ROCKY MTN. CASING CREW
19:30 - 04:00 8.50{CSG |2 RUN 7" CASING LINER,162 JT'S (84 JT'S 29# P110/78 JT'S 26# P110) BREAK
CIRCULATION EVERY 25 JT'S
04:00 - 05:00 1.00/CSG |2 R/D CASING EQUIPMENT, FILL UP TOOL & LAY DOWN MACHINE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{CSG |2 MAKE UP LINER HANGER ASSEMBLY
5/4/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50/csG |1 RIG DOWN CASING CREW
06:30 - 07:30 1.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOOTMS UP ON FIRST STAND OF DRILL PIPE
07:30 - 12:30 5.00(CSG |4 TRIP IN HOLE 59 STANDS/FILL EVERY TEN STANDS(BREAK CIRCULATION)
12:30 - 13:30 1.00/{CSG |1 WASH DOWN 3 STANDS
13:30 - 19:30 6.00/CIRC |1 CIRCULATE WHILE RECIPROCATING LINER/SHAKE OUT LCM IN PIT SYSTEM
LOST APOX 650 BBL
19:30 - 20:00 0.50|CSG |4 HANG LINER WITH SMITH HAND
20:00 - 00:30 as50/CMT |2 HELD SAFETY MEETING AND CEMENT WITH HALLIBURTON (LOST RETURN'S
59 BBL INTO DISPLACEMENT )
PUMP CEMENT & DISPLACE CMT IN PLACE @ 0030 HRS BUMPED PLUB W/
500 PS! OVER CIRULATION
FLOAT HELD LEAD CEMENT TOTAL 1300 SACKS 4% GEL, 20% SSA-1, 3
LBS/SK SIL. .6% HALAD-344, 2% SUPER
: TAIL CEMENT TOTAL 100 SACKS 2% GEL, 20% SSA-1, 3 LBS/SK SIL., 5%
! HALAD-344,.2% HALAD-413,.2%HR
12, .7% SUPER CBL, .2% SUSPEND-HT
00:30 - 01:00 0.50{CMT |1 LAY DOWN CEMENTING HEAD & HAL. CEMENT LINES
01:00 - 01:30 050|TRP |2 PULL 5 STANDS
01:30 - 03:00 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE 2X BOTTOMS UP
03:00 - 06:00 3.00[TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE W/ 7" LINER RUNNING TOOL & LAY DOWN RUNNING
TOOL ASSEMBLY
5/5/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|{CSG |4 TRIP OUT AND LAY DOWN 7" LINER HANGER
07:00 - 08:30 1.50|TRP |2 PICK UP PILOT AND POLISH MILL FOR TOP OF LINER AND TRIP IN HOLE TO
CLEAN TOP OF LINER
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code CSc;jdbe Description of Operations
5/5/2007 08:30 - 09:30 1.00| OTH CUT AND SLIP DRILLING LINE
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
10:30 - 11:00 050|TRP |2 TRIP IN AND TAG TOP WITH POLISH MILL (NO ROTATION)
11:00 - 14:00 3.00| OTH STING INTO LINER TOP/ ROTATE TORQUING UP (MEASURED OUT TO BE
MILL IN IN LINER CATCH WOULD HANG UP IF PIPE WASN'T ROTATING,
MILLED AND WORK UP AND OWN THROUGH ROTATING, COULD WORK UP
AND DOWN THROUGH FULL STROKE OF CLEAN OUT TOOL WITH NO
PROBLEMS,
14:00 - 16:30 250[TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO SEE WHAT MILL LOOKS LIKE/HAD LITTLE WEAR/
LAYDOWN CLEAN OUT TOOL
16:30 - 21:30 500/ TRP |2 TRIP IN (SLOW) WITH PACKER TO SET IN LINER HANGER
21:30 - 00:30 300/CcsG |4 STING IN AND SET PACKER SEAL ASSEMBLY/ PRESSURE TEST SEALS 300
PS) AND POSITIVE TEST @ 1500 PSI FOR 30 MIN.
00:30 - 01:00 0.50| OTH PULL OUT TWO STANDS TO DO A NEGITIVE TEST ON LINER LAP
01:00 - 02:30 1.50| OTH FILL PILL TANK WITH WATER TRUCK AND DISPLACE MUD OUT OF HOLE
FOR NEGITIVE TEST ON LINER PACKER
02:30 - 03:30 1.00|0EQ |2 CARRY OUT NEGATIVE TEST ON 7' LINER & PACKER - OK -
03:30 - 05:00 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE OUT WATER & DISPLACE WELL TO 12.7 MUD.
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON MASTER CLUTCH
5/6/2007 06:00-06:00 |  24.00| RIG 2 REPAIR MASTER CLUTCH ON COMPOUND AND AIR LINES- WHILE WORKING
ON MASTER CLUTCH CLEANED MUD TANKS & BUILD MUD VOLUME
5/7/2007 06:00-20:30 | 14.50|RIG |2 WORK ON MASTER CLUTCH (ROADS WERE CLOSED,COULDN'T BRING
CLUTCH OUT OF CASPER ROADS OPENED UP AROUND 9:00 AM CLUTCH
SHOWED ON LOCATION @ 16:30¥CHANGED OUT LINER'S IN PUMP TO 5
20:30 - 01:30 5.00{TRP |3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE IN MOUSE HOLE WHILE WAITING ON LAY DOWN
TRUCK (DO TO RIG REPAIR/DIDNT KNOW WHEN THE RIG WAS GOING TO
RUN PROPERLY)
01:30 - 02:30 1.00|TRP |3 RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK
02:30 - 03:00 0.50| TRP |3 LAY DOWN 5" DRILL PIPE USING L/D TRUCK TO 300"
03:00 - 03:30 050|TRP |2 REMOVE ROTATING HEAD
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| TRP |3 CONTINUE TO LAY DOWN 5" DRILL PIPE USING LAY DOWN TRUCK
04:00 - 04:30 0.50| TRP |3 RIG DOWN LAY DOWN EQUIPMENT
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| TRP |3 TRIP IN HOLE TO LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE
5/8/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50| TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE 55 STANDS TO LAY DOWN
06:30 - 09:30 3.00|TRP |3 LAY DOWN 5" DRILL PIPE
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE 11 STANDS TO LAY DOWN
10:00 - 11:00 1.00|TRP |3 LAY DOWN 5" DRILL PIPE
11:00 - 12:00 1.00| OTH CHANGE SAVER SUB AND GRABBER DIES (CHANGE TO 4" TOOLS)
12:00 - 19:00 7.00/BOP |2 TEST BOP TO 10,000 PSI AND 250 PS| LOWS (TOP AND BOTTOM PIPE RAMS,
BLIND RAMS, HCR, CHOKE MANIFOLD, TOP DRIVE VALVES, TIW, DART
VALVE) 7500 PSI AND 250 LOW (ANNULAR), CASING TEST 1500 PS!| FOR 30
MIN.
19:00 - 19:30 0.50] OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
19:30 - 21:00 150{TRP |2 RIG UP AND PICK UP BHA AND 4" DRILL-DRIFTING-
21:00 - 21:30 0.50{ OTH INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER
21:30 - 01:00 350{TRP {2 PICK UP 4" DRILL PIPE BREAK CIRCULATION ( EVERY 1000 )
01:00 - 02:00 1.00{TRP |2 STRAP 140 JTS OF 4" DRILL PIPE ON PIPE RACK
02:00 - 06:00 400[TRP |2 CONTINUE TO PICK UP 4" DRILL PIPE
5/9/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250|TRP |2 PICK UP 4" DRILL PIPE-DRIFT SAME-CIRCULATE EVERY 30 JOINTS
08:30 - 09:30 1.00|TRP |2 RACK AND STRAP DRILL PIPE
09:30 - 13:30 4.00|RIG 2 WENT TO AJUST BRAKES AND BRAKE BLOCK FELL OUT OF BAND (PULL
AND VISUAL INSPECT BANDS (PUT NEW BRAKE BLOCK'S ON-BURN IN THE
SAME)
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
5/9/2007 13:30 - 17:00 3.50|TRP |2 PICK UP 4" DRILL PIPE -DRIFT
17:00 - 18:00 1.00/CSG |1 RIG DOWN LAY DOWN TRUCK
18:00 - 19:30 150|DRL |4 DRILL OUT LAND COLLAR @ 12520, FLOAT SHOE @ 12,563,SHOE @12,607
(CEMENT WAS SOFT EASY DRILLING/SURFACE SAMPLES ARE DRY BUT
PRETTY FLAKY)
19:30 - 20:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12612 TO 12617
20:00 - 21:30 150|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP TO PERFORM FIT TEST
21:30 - 22:00 0.50|EQT |2 FORMATION INTEGRITY TEST 2000 PS| WITH 12.6 MUD WT=EQUIV. TO 15.64
MW
22:00 - 04:30 6.50| TRP |2 TRIP QUT OF HOLE TO RUN LOGS THROUGH CASING/ PULL ROTATING
HEAD
04:30 - 06:00 150|LOG |2 HELD SAFETY MEETING W/ SCH. LOGGING CREW - RIG UP LOGGING
EQUIPMENT & P/U LOGGING TOOLS
5/10/2007  |06:00-22:00 | 16.00|LOG |2 LOGGING IN CASED HOLE W/ SWS, SONIC SCAN - CBL-VDL-P/S TD - BSC.
LTD 12596’
22:00 - 23:00 1.00|LOG RD LOGGERS
23:00 - 06:00 7.00{TRP {10 PU BI-CENTER BIT, MUD MOTOR, & TIH, RAN BHA & 1 ROW OF DP, FiLL PIPE
& BREAK CIRC, THEN EA. 3 ROWS. TAKING AN HOUR TO FILL PIPE, #1 PUMP
NOT PUMPING, & DRILLER FORGOT TO OPEN MUD VALVE & BLEW A NAIL
LAST FILL.
5/11/2007  |06:00 - 07:30 1.50| TRP |10 TIH, FILL PIPE EA 2 ROWS, INSTALL ROTATING HEAD
07:30 - 09:30 2.00| RIG 2 TAG BOTTOM, WORK ON PUMPS, PRESSURED UP.
09:30 - 10:30 1.00|CIRC |1 CA&C, MIX & PUMP PILL
10:30 - 17:00 6.50| TRP |10 TOH F/ EXCESS PRESSURE. 4 NOZZLES PLUGGED DRY FIRST 20 STANDS,
THEN CAME WET THE REST OF THE WAY OUT.
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| TRP |10 PU & MU NEW BIT, LOST SLIP SEGMENT DOWN HOLE.
18:30 - 20:30 2.00|WOT |4 LD MUD MOTOR & BIT, WO JUNK BASKET
20:30 - 01:30 5.00|TRP |2 PU MILL TOOTH BIT, JUNK SUB, BIT SUB, & TIH RAN BHA & 1 ROW DP FILL
PIPE, THEN FILL PIPE EA. 4 ROWS
01:30 - 02:30 1.00| OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB
02:30 - 06:00 3.50[TRP |2 TIH, FILL PIPE EA. 4 ROWS.
5/12/2007  |06:00 - 06:30 0.50|TRP |3 TIH W/ JUNK SUB
06:30 - 07:00 0.50| REAM |1 W&R 50' TO BOTTOM, 5' FiLL
07:00 - 09:30 250[DRL |1 WORK JUNK BASKET, NO EXCESS TORQUE AT ANY TIME WHILE WORKING
OR WHILE DRILLING 17' OF NEW HOLE IT WAS AS IF SEGMENT WAS NOT
THERE. ONE HAND SWEARS HE SAW IT HIT THE MUD IN THE ANNULAS SO
DON'T KNOW WHAT TO MAKE OF IT.
09:30 - 11:30 2.00[{CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP & PUMP PILL F/ TOH
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE CHAIN ON PIPE SPINNERS, DIDN'T HAVE A NEW ONE ON
LOCATION, HAD TO WAIT FOR IT TO BE DELIVERED BEFORE WE COULD
REPLACE IT, USING SPINNERS TO BACK OUT DP JUST IN CASE.
12:00 - 15:00 3.00[TRP |2 TOH W/ JUNK BASKET
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR CHAIN ON SPINNER
15:30 - 17:00 1.50[TRP |2 TOH W/ JUNK BASKET & FILL TRIP TANK
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE CHAIN ON SPINNERS
17:30 - 20:30 3.00 FINISH TOH W/ BASKET, EMPTY CONTENTS, FOUND 5 PC OF STEEL, 1 PC OF
TONG DIE ABOUT 1 1/2° LONG W/ A LARGE SCRAP THAT WOULD MATCH UP
W/ CUTTERS ON BI-CENTER, & 4 SMALLER PCS. BIT HAD NO JUNK MARKS
ON IT AT ALL. ALSO BROUGHT OUT 23 PCS OF ALUMIINUM THE LARGEST IS
ABOUT 1 1/4" x 3/4" X 1/4"
20:30 - 22:30 2.00|RIG 2 REPLACE TABLE LOCK ON BREAK OUT SIDE.
22:30 - 06:00 750|TRP |2 PU BI-CENTER BIT, MUD MOTOR, XO & TIH, RAN BHA & 1 ROW, FILL PIPE &
CIRC THEN RUN 4 ROWS AT A TIME, FILL PIPE & CIRC.
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csc;]dbe Description of Operations
5/13/2007  |06:00 - 13:30 750{DRL |1 DRILL 12634' - 12797', 163, 21.73 FPH, WBO 10-11K, RPM 60 ON SURFACE, &
59 DOWN HOLE. 227 GPM.
13:30 - 14:30 1.00{ RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
14:30-06:00 | 1550(DRL |1 DRILL 12797 - 13155', 366', 22.96 FPH, WOB 8-12, RPM 120, 60 ON SURFACE &
60 DOWN HOLE. 230 GPM. LOWER WT SEEMS TO DRILL SLOWER, HOPE TO
BE @ CORE POINT AROUND 18:00 THIS EVENING.
5/14/2007  |06:00 - 13:30 750|DRL |1 DRILL 13155' - 128", 17.06 FPH, WOB 8-12, RPM 120, 60 ON SURFACE, 60
DOWN HOLE, 230 GPM.
13:30 - 14:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
14:30 - 20:00 550{DRL |1 DRILL 13283 - 13275', 92, 16.72 FPH, WOB 8-14, RPM 120, 60 ON SURFACE, 60
DOWN HOLE. 230 GPM.
20:00 - 00:30 450{CIRC 1 C&C F/ GORE, MIX PILL.
00:30 - 01:00 050{SUR |1 DROP SURVEY @ 13313', CHECK FLOW, FLOWING 1/2" STREAM FOR 30 MIN.
01:00 - 05:00 4.00{CIRC |1 BRING PREMIX TO 13.6 PPG, & SPOT 250 BBL OF 13.6 PPG MUD ON BOTTOM
F/ TOH BOTTOMS UP FLARE 8', 3000U+ BUG SPIKE AT BOTTOMS UP.
5/15/2007  {06:00 - 10:00 4.00{TRP |2 TOH F/ CORE #1 CAME WET @ STAND # 80 OUT.
10:00 - 11:30 1.50{CIRC |1 C&C, MIX #2 PILL
11:30 - 13:30 2.00{TRP |2 FINISH TOH F/ CORE #1, STILL WET AT TIMES. RETRIEVE MULTISHOT
SURVEY TOOL, SURVEY @ 13313 2.3 DEG, 112.6 AZ.
113:30 - 15:30 200{TRP {2 LD MOTOR & BIT, PU CORE BBL & BIT, FUNCTION BOTH PIPES, & BLIND
i RAMS
15:30 - 16:30 1.00{TRP |2 TIH W/ BHA & 2 STANDS OF DP, FILL PIPE & CIRC 2 MIN.
16:30 - 18:00 1.50|RIG 6 SLIP & CUT 162' OF DRLG. LINE
18:00 - 19:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE.
19:00 - 22:30 350|TRP |2 TIH W/ 4 ROWS DP, FILL PIPE & CIRC. REPEAT EA. 4 ROWS TO 8612, CIRC 1
MIN., 9682, CIRC 2 MIN, TIH TO 11828' FILL PIPE & CIRC EA. 4 ROWS.
22:30 - 01:30 3.00/CIRC |1 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD @ 11828' & CIRC BOTTOMS UP. 1’ FLARE. 2375u
GAS
01:30 - 03:00 1.50[ TRP |2 TiH, FILL PIPE @ 12602, TIH TO 13375'
03:00 - 06:00 3.00[{CIRC |1 FILL PIPE & CIRC BOTTOMS UP, 8' FLARE 1 1/2 HR INTO CIRC. DROP BALL
TO START CORING.
5/16/2007  |06:00-17:00 | 11.00{DRL |1 CUT CORE #1, 13375' - 13435, 60", 5.45 FPH, WOB 4-10K RPM 65, 180 GPM.
17:00 - 21:00 4.00[CIRC |1 BREAK OFF CORE, C&C F/ TOH W/ CORE #1 BOTTOMS UP GAS 4012u
21:00 - 22:00 1.00{CIRC |1 SPOT 230 BBL OF 13.6 PPG MUD ON BOTTOM.
22:00 - 06:00 8.00|TRP |2 TOH W/ CORE #1
5/17/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|GEO |2 LD CORE #1, 100% RECOVERY, 60"
07:00 - 08:00 1.00{GEO |2 CHANGE BITS & SPACE OUT.
08:00 - 13:00 5.00{TRP |2 TIH F/ CORE #2, FILL PIPE & CIRC @ BHA & 1 ROW DP, THEN EA 4 ROWS TO
76 STANDS & CIRC 5 MIN. RIH TO 11832'.
13:00 - 13:30 050{TRP |2 PULL STRIPPING RUBBER OUT OF BERRING ASSM, & INSTALL ROTATING
HEAD RUBBER.
13:30 - 14:00 0.50{CIRC |1 CIRC. 30 MIN.
14:00 - 15:00 1.00|TRP |2 TIH W/ LAST 18 STANDS PU 2 JTS OF DP..
15:00 - 17:00 2.00{CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP. BUG = 2548u 2' FLARE.
17:00-06:00 | 13.00{GEO |2 TAG BOTTOM, & START CORE #2 @ 13435' - 13487", 52, 4.0 FPH, WOB 4-10,
RPM 65, 180 GPM. HOPE TO BE @ 13495’ BY 08:00.
5/18/2007 | 06:00 - 08:30 250|GEO |2 CORE, 13487' - 13495', 8', 4.0 FPH, WOB 9-10K, RPM 65, 180 GPM.
08:30 - 10:30 2.00[CIRC |1 BREAK CORE, CIRC BOTTOMS UP, MUD LOGGERS EQUIPMENT QUIT
WORKING, NO ACCURATE GAS READING
10:30 - 18:00 750|TRP |2 CHECK F/ FLOW, PUMP PILL, TOH W/ CORE #2. LOST 14 BBL OF MUD ON
TOH.
:18:00 - 19:00 1.00|GEO |2 LD CORE #2, 100% RECOVERY, 60+
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code c?:dbe Description of Operations
5/18/2007  |19:00 - 01:30 650/ TRP |10 PU BIT, MUD MOTOR, XO, & TIH TO 5500', BREAK CIRC. THEN EA. 4 ROWS TO
12603’
01:30 - 02:00 0.50| RIG 8 REMOVE GRABBER BOX F/ TOP DRIVE.
02:00 - 04:00 2.00[CIRC |1 CIRC. BOTTOMS UP
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|RIG 2 REPLACE TORQUE CONVERTER SEAL ON #2 FLOOR MOTOR
5/19/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00 RIG 2 REPAIR RIG, FINISH REPALCING SEAL IN TORQUE CONVERTER ON #2
FLOOR MOTOR
09:00 - 10:00 1.00{ RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
10:00 - 10:30 0.50[ TRP |10 FINISH TIH PU 2 JTS DP.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00{REAM |1 W&REAM 120' TO BOTTON, DRILL UP CORE STUMP
14:30-06:00 | 18.50{DRL |1 DRILL 13495' - 13835, 340", 18.37 FPH, WOB 8-14K, RPM 120, 60 ON
SURFACE, 60 DOWN HOLE. 230 GPM BOP DRILL BOTH CREWS. 13715' -
13720' TOOK 2 HOURS TO DRILL,
5/20/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 5.00[DRL |1 DRILLING 13835’ - 13931', 96', 19.2 FPH, WOB 10-11K, RPM 120, 60 ON
SURFACE, 60 DOWN HOLE 230 GPM
11:00 - 12:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
12:00 - 17:00 5.00[DRL |1 DRILL 13931’ - 14043', 112, 22.2 FPH, WOB 10-11K, RPM 120, 60 ON SURFACE,
60 DOWN HOLE, 230 GPM
17:00 - 18:30 1.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, BOTH PUMPS DOWN, NOTHING REALY STOOD OUT AS THE
PROBLEM, BUT | THINK WE MAY HAVE A CHARGE PUMP PROBLEM.
18:30 - 00:00 550[DRL |1 DRILL 14034’ - 14116', 73, 13.27 FPH, WOB 10-14k, RPM 45-65 ON SURFACE,
60 DOWN HOLE, 230 GPM GAS TO SURFACE
00:00 - 06:00 6.00jwcL |1 8108u GAS TO SURFACE VENTING THROUGH BUSTER, CIRC OUT GAS ON
BUSTER, 12-25' FLARE. PUMP PRESSURE STARTED FALLING OFF @ 14101",
NOT MUCH INCREASE IN FLOW UNTIL JUST BEFORE GAS HIT SURFACE.
LOOSING 8.5 BPH MUD, CIRC W/ 15-25' FLARE, BGG 300 - 400u THROUGH
BUSTER.
5/21/2007  [06:00 - 14:30 gsofwcL |1 CIRC OUT GAS ON CHOKE, RAISED WT F/ 13.3 - 13.5, SHUT IN WELL CHECK
F/ PRESSURE, NONE. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP 3 TIMES, THEN CHECKED
F/ FLOW, NONE, STARTED TO CIRCULATE, FLOW F/ 0 - 50%, VERY SPRATIC.
FLOW STEADY WHILE ON CHOKE, GAINING VOLUME WHILE CIRCULATING,
RUNNING 7 BPH OF MU WATER.
14:30-03:00 | 1250(DRL |1 DRILL 14116’ - 14330", 214', 17.12 FPH, WOB 2-8, RPM 120, 60 ON SURFACE, 60
DOWN HOLE, FLOW HAS BEEN ERATIC SINGE WE HAVE BEEN BACK TO
DRILLING, THIS TIME IT LOOKS AS THOUGH WE TOOK ABOUT A 50 BBL
GAIN. WHEN GAS HIT SURFACE IT BLEW THE FLOW SENSOR OUT OF THE
FLOW LINE.
03:00 - 06:00 3oolweL |1 SHUT IN WELL, FCP AT 1100 PS1 AND CLIMBING WITH CHOKE 1/2 OPEN, 3"
CHOKE LINE LEAKING, S WELL TO FIX & SICP HIT 1750 IN 3 MIN. OPENED
CHOKE BACK UP FCP @ 1600 W/ CHOKE 1/4 OPEN. HAVE NOT TRIED TO
GET A SIDPP AS SHOE IS ONLY GOOD TO 2650 PSI WILL TRY TO GET MUD
ON BACK SIDE, APPEARS TO BE LOOSING FLUID AS DPP WILL CLIMB TO
1100 PSI & FALL OFF TO 1070 PSI, FCP WILL FALL TO 1600 THEN CLIMB TO
1700-1800.
5/22/2007  {06:00-20:00 | 14.00|WCL |1 CIRC OUT GAS ON CHOKE, RAUSED MW F/ 13.6 PPG TO 14.0 PPG, MADE 3
COMPLETE CIRCULATIONS, SICP 0. SIDPP 0. OPNED ANNULAR, NO FLOW.
20:00 - 20:30 0.50|wcL |1 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD BERRING ASSM. WELL SWABBING WHEN
WE PULLED STAND TO CHANGE UT HEAD.
20:30 - 22:00 1.50|wcL |1 STARTED TO CIRC THROUGH BUSTER, GAINED 52 BBL
22:00 - 06:00 soolwcL |1 SIW & CIRC OUT GAS ON CHOKE, RAISING MW TO 14.2 PPG. ON CIRC #2 AT
PRESENT, CHOKE FULL OPEN, MW IN 14.2, MW OUT 13.9 GAS CUT, GAINING
FLUID SINCE 01:46, PARTIAL MU WATER, PARTIAL BARITE ADDITIONS, BUT
STILL SEEM TO BE IN EXCESS OF THAT. WILL SEE BOTTOMS UP AROUND
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cségje Description of Operations
5/22/2007  |22:00 - 06:00 8.00|wCL |1 06:00
5/23/2007  |06:00-06:00 | 24.00| WCL |1 CIRC OUT GAS ON CHOKE, MADE 3 CIRCULATIONS, CHECK F/ FLOW, WELL
STATIC F/ 3 MIN, THEN FLOWING 27 BPH, SURGING, LET WELL FLOW 30 MIN,
GAINED 6 BBL ACCORDING TO PVTS. SI & MONITOR PRESSURES, SICP
STABILIZED @ 340,SICP SLOW STROKE PUMP, FLOAT OPENED @ 275
SIDPP. CIRC & RAISED WT TO 14.7 PPG, FIRST ROUND, THEN TO 15.0 ON
SECOND ROUND. CIRC ROUNG #3 BEFORE CHECKING F/ FLOW, MW IN
15.0,MW OUT 14.6 AT REPORT TIME.
5/24/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE THROUGH CHOKE
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| OTH OPEN ANNULAR AND CHECK FOR FLOW (NO FLOW)
07:30 - 09:30 2.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP TO SEE GAS/ FLARE SIZE (6'-8')/5400 GAS UNITS
PEAK
09:30 - 16:30 7.00/DRL |1 RESUME DRILLING FROM 14,330 TO 14,450 (ROP 17' HR) WOB 10K, 44 ROT,
92 STROKES,
16:30 - 17:30 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE /GREASE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
17:30 - 02:30 9.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 14,450 TO 14,644 (ROP 21.5' HR.)
02:30 - 03:30 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS HAD 11 BBL GAIN AND GAIN IN GAS UNITS,
03:30 - 06:00 250[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 14,644 TO 14,690 (ROP 18.4' HR.)
5/25/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 14,690 TO 14,775 (ROP 18.9' HR) WOB 8-10/ ROT. RPM 44/
SPM 92
10:30 - 11:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS- LOST TOTAL RETURNS FOR 5-7 MIN (DRY GAS 15-20'
FLARE) REGAIN RETURN WITH NO LOSSES
11:00 - 19:30 850/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 14,775 TO 14,890 (ROP 13.5' HR) TRY DIFFERNT PERAMITORS
TO GET TO DRILL-NO LUCK FRILLING A STEADY 7'-9' HR
19:30 - 21:30 2.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP & BUILD PILL FILL TRIP TANK
21:30 - 22:00 0.50/SUR |1 DROP SURVEY
22:00 - 22:30 0.50|CIRC 1 PUMP 1# OVER PILL AND SPOT
22:30 - 23:30 1.00{TRP {10 TRIP OUT FOR BIT #23 AND MUD MOTOR TO 13046, (HOLE NOT TAKING
PROPER FILL STOPPED AND CHECK FOR FLOW-SLIGHT FLOW
23:30 - 03:30 400|CRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP TWICE WHILE BUILDING #2 SLUG/GAS IS
FEEDING IN FROM BOTTOM SO DISCUSSED WITH STEVE AND DECIDED TO
TRIP TO BOTTOM AND BRING WT UP
03:30 - 05:00 150]TRP |2 TRIP IN 19 STANDS
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE THROUGH HALF CHOKE HOLDING STAND PIPE PSi @
1200-CASING 900/ (PUMP WENT DOWN WENT TO SWITCH PUMP AND GAIN
30 BBLS, SHUT IN WELL 1900 PSI ON CSING
5/26/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 5.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATING THROUGH CHOKE-OFF CHOKE @ 6:45-B0TTOMS UP 30-35'
FLARE/30 BBL GAIN, BRING MUD WT UP TO 15.5 ALL THE WAY AROUND,
BUILD 2# SLUG TO SPOT
11:00 - 12:00 1.00|CIRC |1 SPOT #2 OVER PILL ALL IN OPEN HOLE AND INTO CASING 20 FEET
12:00 - 13:00 1.00|TRP |10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE 10 STANDS (SLOW) (NOT TAKING PROPER AMOUNT OF
FLUID (NONE GOING BACK INTO PIT IN OVER FILL TUBE)
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| OTH STOPPED CHECK FOR FLOW WELL STILL FLOWING BUT WASN'T GAINING IN
MUD TANKS, CHECKED EQUIPMENT-CHARGE PUMP WAS ON HAND IN PUMP
HOUSE, CHECK FLOW GAIN (NO FLOW)
13:30 - 14:30 1.00|TRP |12 TRIP TO SHOE (WET)-SLOW
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 PUMP DRY SLUG AND FILL TRIP TANK CHECK FLOW (NO FLOW)
15:00 - 20:00 500|TRP |12 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
20:00 - 21:00 1.00| OTH HANDLE BHA AND CHANGE MUD MOTOR AND BI CENTER BIT/ SURVEY 1.2
@14,836 (FUNCTION TEST BOPE EQUIP MENT)
21:00 - 04:00 7.00|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE BREAK CIRCULATION AT BHA AND EVERY 33
STANDS DEPTHS- 1292, 4116, 7417, 10,622 (RAN 3 FT FLARE ON TRIP IN /
WELL WAS NOT FLOWING ON FLOW CHECKS)
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24

Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations

5/26/2007 04:00 - 04:30 0.50| CIRC
04:30 - 06:00 1.50|RIG
5/27/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|RIG
07.00 - 07:30 0.50| TRP
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| CIRC
08:00 - 08:30 0.50| TRP
08:30 - 10:30 2.00{CIRC

BREAK CIRCULATION @ SHOE

SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE @ SHOE (18 WRAPS)

SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE FUNCTION ANNULAR

TRIP IN TWELVE STANDS-SLOW

BREAK CIRCULATION, CIRCULATE 1/2 OF 2# SLUG INTO CASING TO BLEND
TRIP IN 11 STANDS SLOW

CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP/ WASH TO BOTTOM STAGE PUMP UP TO BREAK
CIRCULATION, PEAK GAS 1600 UNITS NO GAIN IN MUD OR FLOW

DRILL FROM 14890 TO 15180 (ROP 14.8' HR)

DRILL FROM 15,180 TO 15,291-(ROP 14.8' HR)-GAS FROM DEPTH OF 15206,
HAD FLOW INCREASE AND AN 18 BBL GAIN IN PITS

SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE

DRILL FROM 15, 291 TO 15,490 (ROP 12.8' HR)

DRILL FROM 15,490 TO 15,583 (ROP 11.6' HR)

RIG SERVICE- GREASE BLOCKS, SWIVEL AND COMPOUND, TOPDRIVE
DRILL FROM 15,583 TO 15654 (ROP 15.7) HAVING TO KEEP WOB 15, CLAY
LIKE SILT STONE COMING OVER SHAKERS

19:30 - 22:30 3.00| CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP 2 TIMES TO CLEAN OUT GAS IN WELL BORE, GAS
WAS FROM DEPTH OF 15,623 CALCULATED, GAINED 30 BBL AND FLARE
15-20' HIGH, GAS UNITS BEST-6100 UNITS SURGED WHEN GAS HIT
SHAKERS BROUGHT MUD WT TO 15.5

22:30 - 06:00 7.50| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 15,654 TO 15,720 (ROP 8.8' HR.)

5/30/2007 06.00 - 09:30 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 15,720 TO 15,777 (ROP 16.2' HR)

09:30 - 10:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
1
1

2 N =N -

-

10:30 - 06:00 19.50( DRL
5/28/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50| DRL

-

13:30-14:30 1.00| RIG
14:30 - 06:00 15.50| DRL
5/29/2007 06:00 - 14:.00 8.00| DRL
14:00 - 16:00 1.00| RIG
15:00 - 19:30 4.50| DRL

RPN QUENRN

10:30 - 11:30 1.00( DRL DRILL FROM 15,777 TO 15,805 (ROP 28' HR)
11:30 - 12:30 1.00| CIRC CIRCULATE OUT GAS THROUGH CHOKE PIT GAIN OF 40 BBL.S/ 100 PSI ON
CASING PRESSURE ON FULL OPEN CHOKE ’

12:30 - 13:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 15,805 TO 15,841 (ROP 72' HR)

13:00 - 13:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE THRU CHOKE ON SECOND BOTTOMS UP-IT HAD A GOOD PUSH
TO IT/PICKED UP AND PUT ON THE CHOKE GAINED 28 BBL.S

13:30-06:00 | 16.50|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 15,841 TO 16,022 (ROP 10.9' HR) (BROUGHT MW TO 5.6 TO
CONTROL CONNECTION GAS SEEMS TO BE HOLDING CONNECTION GAS
BACK)

5/31/2007  06:00 - 10:00 4.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 16,022 TO 16,069 (ROP 11.75' HR)
10:00 - 11:00 1.00|RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
11:00-06:00 | 19.00|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 16,068 TO 16,295 (ROP 11.89' HR) @ 16,209 SLOWED DOWN TO

9 FOOT A HOUR, CHANGE BIT PERAMETERS NO CHANGE/ CHECKED WITH
MUD LOGGER CHANGED FROM 80% SHALE, 10% SILTSTONE, 10%
SANDSTONE CHANGED TO 50% SHALE, 50% SILTSTONE STARTED PICKING

UP @ 16,269
6/1/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50| DRL DRILL FROM 16, 295 TO 16,360 (ROP 11.8' HR) WOB 15, DHRPM 110, MW 156.5
11:30- 12:30 1.00{RIG SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE

12:30 - 18:00 5.50{ DRL
18:00 - 06:00 12.00; RIG

DRILL FROM 16,360 TO 16,452

WORK ON SWAB, LINER, DIS-CHARGE MODULE ON #2 MUD PUMP OFF BULL
WHEEL SIDE/ #1 MUD PUMP CROSS HEAD OUT PUMP IS UNOPERATABLE,
CHANGE OUT SWIVEL PACKING ALSO ( CAN'T CIRCULATE, WORK PIPE UP
AND DOWN)WELL STARTED FLOWING 1 BBL HR SHUT IN WELL AT 00:00, @
2:30 WELL HAD ZERO CASING PRESSURE OPEN WELL AND RE CHECK
FLOW AND WORK PIPE (WELL FLOWING 3/4 BBL AN HOUR) RE SHUT IN
WELL

6/2/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50| RIG 2 WORK ON #2 PUMP MODULE,COULDN'T GET HEX-BOLT'S OUT OF MODULE,
MONITORING WELL (#1 PUMP HAS X-HEAD QUT)# PUMP WAS READY @
11:30

N =
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code g:dbe Description of Operations
6/2/12007 10:30 - 15:00 450|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS-BOTTOMS UP TWICE WITH HALLIBURTON (5 BBL MIN)
FIRST HAD A GOOD PUSH HAD TO SHUT IN AND HOLD 3/4 CHOKE WITH 300
PS1 ON CHOKE HAD 32 BBL GAIN, GAS UNITS ALL OVER DUE TO LEVEL OF
MUD AT SHAKERS 35' FLARE AT PEAK
15:00 - 16:30 1.50{CIRC |1 SPOT 190 BBL PILL 17.4 OVER FALLOWED BY 130 BBL 15.5 MUD
16:30 - 01:00 850|TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE SLOW TO SHOE-TIGHT SPOT'S AT 15,510, 15,164 PULLED
UP WORKED DOWN AND PULLED THROUGH WITH REG. DRAG (LOOKS
GOOD) FLOW CHECKED AT SHOE (NO FLOW)
01:00 - 02:30 150| TRP |1 HANDLE BHA LAY DOWN MUD MOTOR AND PICK UP HIGH SPEED MUD
MOTOR AND SURFACE TEST 200 GPM 500 PSI, PICK AND LAY DOWN JARS
02:30 - 06:00 350|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE FILL PIPE AT BHA, AND EVERY 3 ROWS
6/3/2007 06:00 - 09:30 350|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE WITH IMPREG AND HIGH SPEED MUD MOTOR, FILL EVERY 33
STANDS TO SHOE FILLS BHA, 4463, 7816, 10,675, 12,738
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| OTH INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER (PULL STRIPPING RUBBER OUT OF ROTATING
HEAD)
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| OTH FIX OIL LEAKS ON TOP DRIVE, CHANGE SAVER SUB, GRABBER DIES
11:30 - 12:00 0.50|TRP |2 TRIP IN 20 STANDS IN OPEN HOLE (SLOW)
12:00 - 12:30 0.50{CIRC |1 BREAK CIRCULATEION, CIRCULATE HEAVY PILL INTO CASING (BLEND)
12:30 - 13:00 050{TRP |2 TRIP AND SCREW INTO LAST STAND TO CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
13:00 - 14:00 1.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE 2# OVER SLUG OUT OF HOLE WHILE WASHING TO BOTTOM
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| OTH CHANGE OUT GASKET ON ROTATING HEAD (LEAKING MUD IN SUB AND
FILLED CELLUR
14:30 - 16:00 1.50[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE 2# OVER SLUG OUT OF HOLE HAD 23 BBL GAIN,10' FLARE, 7002
UNITS OF PEAK GAS
16:00 - 20:00 4.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 16,452 TO 16,472 (ROP 5' HR)
20:00 - 20:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR SHUT DOWN DRILLING TO PULL OFF PUMP SHED TOP AND
PUMP OUT WITH CRANE
20:30 - 06:00 9.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 186, 472 TO 16,522 (ROP 5.25' HR) WOB 12/ ROT 65/ GPM 242/
DHRPM 522
6/4/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 16,522 TO 16,559 (ROP 5.2' HR) WOB 12, ROT 65, DHRPM 527
(DAKOTA SILT CAME IN @ 16,516)
13:00 - 14:00 1.00|RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE (GREASE COMPOUND, DRAW-WORKS, TOP
DRIVE, SWIVEL PACKING)
14:00-06:00 | 16.00{ DRL 1 DRILL FROM 16,559 TO 16,661 (ROP 6.3' HR) WOB 14, ROT 65, DHRPM 527
6/5/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50{ DRL 1 DRILL FROM 16,661 TO 16,721 (ROP 9.2' HR) TALK TO BLM FOR EXTENSION
FOR BOPE TEST TALKED TO RAY ARNOLD AND IT WAS OKED BY MATT
BAKER
12:30 - 13:30 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, GREASE TOP DRIVE, COMPOUND, DRAW-TOOL
13:30-06:00 | 16.50| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 16,721 TO 16,878 (ROP 9.5' HR)
6/6/2007 06:00 - 10:00 400|DRL |1 DRILL 16,878 TO 16,916 (ROP 9.5' HR) WOB 13, RPM 62, DHRPM 497
10:00 - 11:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE TOP DRIVE, COMPOUND, SWIVEL, DRAWTOOL
11:00-03:30 | 1650/ DRL |1 DRILL 16,916 TO 17,045 (ROP 7.8' HR) WOB 15, RPM 65, DHRPM 500
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| OTH WORK TIGHT HOLE ON CONNECTION, WORK UP THROUGH (WANTED TO
PACK OFF), WORK BACK TO BOTTOM 1' OF TIGHT SPOT
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|DRL  [1 DRILL 17,045 TO 17,060 (ROP 7.5' HR) WOB 15, RPM 65, DHRPM 500
6/7/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00|DRL |1 DRILL 17060 - 17110', 50", 6.25 FPH, WOB 14K, RPM 65 ON SURFACE & 500
DOWN HOLE
14:00 - 15:30 1.50| RIG 1 SREVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, WORK TIGHT CONNECTION FOR AN HOUR OF
THIS
15:30 - 16:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL 17110' - 17114, 4 CALLED TD FOR THIGH CONNECTIONS, RAISING MW
TO 15.5 PPG
16:00 - 21:00 5.00|CIRC |1 CIRC & COND F/ SHORT TRIP, RAISING MW TO 15.5 PPG.
21:00 - 22:30 150|TRP |14 STARTED SHORT TRIP, FIRST 5 STANDS TIGHT, PUMPED OUT #2 & 3
\
\
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To { Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
6/7/2007 22:30 - 23:00 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMPED 30 BBL PILL, CAME WET, PULLED 3 MORE STANDS, PUMP MORE
PILL
23:00 - 01:30 250|TRP |14 FINISHED SHORT TRIP WET, WASHED LAST 90' TO BOTTOM. NO FILL
01:30 - 06:00 450[CIRC |1 C&C, GAINED 52 BBL, SHUT WELL IN & CIRC THORUGH CHOKE, OPENED

WELL BACK UP, INCREASED STROKES, PRESSURE CAME UP, PIPE MOVES
FREE, WHEN YOU SHUT DOWN THE PUMP THE PRESSURE DROPS RIGHT
OFF. 05:45, MOVED PIPE DOWN & SET 3K ON BIT, PRESSURE DROPPED
OFF, AS OF NOW PRESSURES ARE ABOUT RIGHT.

6/8/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00|CIRC |1 C&C, CIRCULATE OUT GAS, MAINTAIN 15.5 PPG MW. MUD MOTOR

PRESSURING UP. SET WT ON BIT AND PRESSURE WOULD FALL OFF FOR A
WHILE.

10:00 - 12:30 2.50{ TRP 2 TOH 7 STANDS, PUMPED OUT #2 & 3, ROTATED THE REST OUT WIITH OUT
PUMP.

12:30 - 13:30 1.00[{CIRC (1 C&C, MOTOR LOCKED UP, BLEW A NAIL

13:30 - 14.00 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE NAIL IN POP OFF.

14:00 - 17:30 350|CIRC (1 CIRC W/ HALIBURTON, BLEW THE PACKING OUT OF DRIVER SIDE PUMP,
CIRC W/ 1 PUMP, BLEW PACKING OUT OF IT ALSO.

17:30 - 23:00 550(CIRC |1 CIRC W/ RIG PUMP @ 53 SPM @ 3 BPM @ 2800 PSI. SPOTTED 250 BBLOF
17.5 PPG MUD @ 16462, & DISPLACED W/ 175 BBL OF 15.5 PPG MUD

23:00 - 06:00 7.00| TRP 2 TOH F/ LOGS W/ SLM, WET & SLOW HOPE TO BE RIGGING UP LOGGERS BY
NOON
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Y 3~c/9- 32790 Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:d'ze Description of Operations
1/24/2007  |06:00 - 08:00 200(Loc |4 RIG DOWN TO SKID RIG FOR TRUCKS
08:00 - 10:00 2.00 RIG UP CRAINE, TRUCKS TO PULL FRONT TWO MATS
10:00 - 15:30 550(LoCc |4 DIG CELLAR IN STALL RING
15:30 - 17:00 1.50{LOC |4 SLID RIG 10' AHEAD W/ 4 TRUCKS, CRAINE , 2 D-8 CATS
17:00 - 00:00 7.00|LOC |4 RIG BACK UP FRONT YARD
00:00 - 06:00 6.00|TRP |1 PICK UP DP STAND IN DERRICK
1/25/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 400{LOC |4 SET GAS BUSTER, CHOKE HOUSE IN W/ CRAIN, FLOW LINE
10:00 - 12:00 2.00 TRYING TO SCREW IN TO BHA STANDING DERRICK
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 KICK PUMPS IN FROZE IN TOP DRIVE
13:00 - 16:00 3.00 STAND BHA BACK IN DERRICK TOP DRIVE BACK OUT DRILL PIPE IN TOP OF
MONEL DC HAD TO GET SCREWED BACK IN MONEL DC
16:00 - 17:00 1.00{RIG {6 UNTHAW TOP DRIVE IN UPPER KELLY COCK
17:00 - 18:00 1.00lTRP |1 PICK UP BHA
18:00 - 21:00 3.00/DRL |1 SPUD IN 17 1/2 HOLE @ 1800 1/24/2007 DRILLING F/21 TO 47'
21:00 - 22:00 1.00|RIG |2 TIGHT UP STAND PIPE UNION
22:00 - 02:30 450{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 47 TO 258
02:30 - 05:00 250{TRP |2 LAY DOWN 6 DP, TO 2 STD 6 5/8 HWD
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|REAM 11 WASH 90' TO BOTTOM
1/26/2007  |06:00 - 06:30 0.50{SUR |1 SURVEY @ 261 1.2 DEG 54.0 AZ
06:30 - 10:30 4.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 258 TO 350
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 CLEAN OUT SUCTION&DISCHARGE LINE ON CELLAR PUMP
11:00 - 11:30 0.50/DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 350 TO 374
11:30 - 12:30 1.00{TRP |2 L/D 5 JTS. PIPE & RUN IN 6 5/8 HWD
12:30 - 16:30 400{DRL |1 DRILLING F/374 TO 526’
16:30 - 17:00 0.50/SUR |1 SURVEY @ 476' 1.7 DEG 39.4 AZ
17:00 - 18:30 150/ TRP |14  |SHORT TRIP TO BIT( SLM BOARD 526.0 STRAP 528.33 NO CORR )
18:30 - 19:30 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRC. SWEEP AROUND RUN 13 3/8 CSG.
19:30 - 22:00 250|TRP |2 TRIP OUT RUN 13 3/8 CASING, L/D 1BS, SHOCK SUB
22:00 - 00:00 200/csG |1 RIG UP CASING CREW, CHANGE OUT BAILES ON TOP DRIVE
00:00 - 03:00 3.00/CSG |2 RUN 12 JTS 13 5/8 CASING K-55 # 54.5 W/ WESTSTATE CASING
03:00 - 04:00 1.00|CIRC |1 RIG UP CIRC 13 3/8 CSG.
04:00 - 06:00 200(CMT |2 RIG CMT. HELD SAFTY MEETING CMT. 13 3/8 CSG
1/27/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 100|CMT |2 CEMENT 13 3/8 CSG. W/ 500 SK. TYP 3 0.2 VERASET, 1% CALCIUM CHLORID,
0.125#/SK POLYFLACK #14.5 PPG.YIELD 1.40 RETRUNED 9.5 BBL TO PIT
FLOAT HELD.PLUG DOWN @ 06:30 RIG DOWN CEMENTER
07:00 - 12:00 5.00|WOT |1 wocC
12:00 - 18:00 6.00/BOP |1 CUT OFF PIPE, CHIP CMT DOWN 1 FT. FOR BASE PLATE ON HEAD, WELD ON
HEAD, TEST TO 1,000 PSI
18:00-06:00 | 12.00(BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOPS
1/28/2007  [06:00-19:00 |  13.00|BOP |2 TEST BOPS,HAD RETIGHT ALL FLANGE, TESTED HYDRILL WING VAVLES,
UNTHAW HCR VALVE, TESTED HCR
19:00 - 20:00 1.00[RIG |2 CHANGE OUT 4 1/2 PIPE RAMS, BLOCKS
20:00 - 22:00 2.00|BOP |2 TEST UPPER KELLY,
22:00 - 00:00 200|RIG |2 FLIP PIPE RAMS OVER
00:00 - 01:00 1.00(BOP |2 CHANGE OUT TEST JT.UNTHAW TOP DRIVE
01:00 - 02:00 1.00|BOP |2 RETEST PIPE RAMS,NO GOOD
02:00 - 06:00 400(RIG |2 NIPPLE DOWN BOPS,WAIT ON NEW DOUBLE GATE FROM QUAIL OUT
CASPER SHOULD BE HEAR @ 12:00 TO DAY
1/29/2007  |06:00-17:00 |  11.00| WOT |4 NIPPE DOWN BOPS , WAIT ON DOUBLE GATE F/ QUAIL IN CASPER,
UNTHAW KELLY HOSE,PUT KELLY HOSE EXT.PIPE ON TO KEEP HOSE OFF
TOP DRIVE
17:00 - 23:00 6.00/BOP |1 NIPPLE UP BOPS
23:00 - 06:00 7.00(BOP |2 TEST BOPS PIPE RAMS, BLINDS, CHOKE MANFOILD, WING VALVE, HCR,
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code C:S:dbe Description of Operations
1/29/2007  |23:00 - 06:00 7.00|BOP |2 CHECK VALVE UPPER, LOEWR KELLY VAVLE, LOW, 250 PSI 5MINS, HIGH
5,000 10 MIN, HY DRILL 250 LOW 5MIN. HIGH 2500 PSi 10 MINS. TEST
CASING TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MINS OK
1/30/2007  |06:00 - 13:30 750|RIG |2 NIPPLE DOWN ROTATING HEAD ADD 14" TO SPOOL WAIT ON WELDER,
REDUE SPOOL FOR ROTATING HEAD,INSTALL WEAR BUSHING, DRILL
MOUSE HOLE,
13:30 - 19:00 550|RIG |2 NIPPLE UP ROTATING HEAD, HOOK UP FLOW LINE
19:00 - 20:30 150|BOP |1 PUT TRUN BUCKLES ON BOP , CENTER BOP UP TO ROTARY TABLE
20:30 - 00:00 3.50| TRP |1 P/ UP BHA
00:00 - 01:00 1.00[TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TAGED CMT AT 470°
01:00 - 04:30 350{DRL |1 DRILLING CMT [FLOAT COLLAR, SHOE, & 10°' NEW HOLE
04:30 - 05:30 100/EQT |2 RIG UP, FIT TEST TO 61 PSI = 10.5 MUD WT BLEAD OFF 10 PSI IN 5MINS
TESTED W/ SINGLE JACK TESTING
05:30 - 06:00 0.50|TRP |3 LAY DOWN SLICK JT . DP , UP SPIRAL HWDP
1/31/2007  |06:00 - 09:30 350|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 526 TO 720
09:30 - 11:00 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRC WHILE WORKING ON PASON EQUIPT.
11:00 - 12:30 1.50|DRL {1 DRILLING F/ 720 TO 812
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| OTH CIRC. WORK ON TOP DRIVE STALLING OUT W/ 10,000 WT
13:00 - 13:30 0.50|DRL |1 DRILLING F/812 TO 830
13:30 - 14:00 0.50| OTH CIRC. WORK ON TOP DRIVE
14:00 - 15:30 150|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 830 TO 904
15:30 - 16:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER.
16:00 - 17:30 150[DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 904 TO 953
17:30 - 20:00 2.50{ OTH WORK ON TOP DRIVE FILLTER COLAPSED
20:00 - 20:30 0.50{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 953 TO 1035
20:30 - 21:30 1.00{SUR |1 SURVEY @ 1,000 1.6 DEG 352 AZ
21:30 - 01:00 350/ DRL |1 DRILL F/ 1035 TO 1147
01:00 - 02:30 1.50| OTH CIRCULATE AND WORK PIPE WHILE CHANGE OUT FLITERS ON TOP DRIVE
12 FILTERS ALL IN BAD CONDITION.
02:30 - 06:00 350|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 1147' TO 1250
2/1/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1250’ TO 1483'
13:00 - 15:30 250|RIG |2 WAITTING ON WELDER AND REPAIR STAND PIPE
15:30 - 17:00 1.50/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1483 TO 1514'
17:00 - 18:00 1.00[SUR |1 RAN WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 1444' 1.9 DEG. 37.30 AZ|
18:00 - 20:30 2.50| DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 1514’ TO 1544
20:30 - 23:00 2550|TRP {13 |TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CASING SHOE DUE TO MOTOR FAILURE ON TOP
DRIVE
23:00 - 03:00 400|RIG |2 CHANGE OUT TOP MOTOR ON TOP DRIVE, AND TESTED MOTOR
03:00 - 04:30 150|TRP |13 |TRIP INHOLE TO 1079'
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 1079’ TO 1544’
21212007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1544' TO 1734’
13:00 - 15:30 2.50| OTH REPAIR PASON
15:30 - 20:30 500|RIG |2 WELDER REPAIR DISCHARGE LINE ON PUMP # 2
20:30 - 22:00 150{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1734’ TO 1796'
22:00 - 23:00 1.00|CIRC |1 MADE CONNECTION HOLE PACKING OFF BENT TWO JOINTS PIPE
CIRCULATED HI VIS SWEEP
23:00 - 00:30 150[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1796' TO 1801"
00:30 - 02:00 150/RIG |2 REPAIR MUD PUMP CHANGE SWAB #1 PUMP
02:00 - 06:00 400|DRL {1 DRILLING FROM TO 1801’ TO 1920'
2/3/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 1900’ TO 2017
11:00 - 11:30 0.50| RIG 1 SERVISE RIGRIG SERVICE
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD
12:00-22:00 | 10.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2017 TO 2203'

Printed: 7/2/2007 1:06:47 PM




QuestarE & P Page 3 of 25

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code g:(?e Description of Operations
2/3/2007 22:00 - 22:30 0.50] OTH REPAIR TOP DRIVE
22:30 - 23:00 0.50|SUR |1 WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 2133' 1.7 DEG. 36.2 AZM
23:00 - 06:00 7.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2203’ TO 2275'
2/4/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2275' TO 2309’
08:30 - 09:00 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMP SWEEPS AND CIRCULATE
09:00 - 12:30 350/ TRP 110 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT
12:30 - 14:30 200|/TRP |10 CHANGE OUT BIT AND TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE TOP DRIVE
15:00 - 15:30 0.50|TRP {10 TRIP IN HOLE HIT BRIDGE AT 873'
15:30 - 23:00 7.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 873' TO 2164 EXCESSIVE AMOUNTS OF PEE
GRAVEL COMING BACK ACROSS SHALE SHAKERS, RAISING WT AND VIS
23:00 - 00:00 1.00{ RIG 2 CHANGE OUT KELLY SAVER SUB
00:00 - 05:00 5.00{TRP |10 PACKED OFF WORKING TIGHT HOLE FROM 2164 BACK REAM UP TO
05:00 - 06:00 1.00[CIRC |1 CIRC. AND RAISE WT TO 9.2, VIS TO 40, REAMING TO BOTTOM
2/5/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 2197 TO 2314
08:30 - 14:00 550/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2309 TO 2390
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
14:30-06:00 | 1550/ DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2390 TO 2757
06:00 - NOTE: AFTER RAISING VIS AND WT, TORQUE WENT AWAY
216/2007 06:00 - 09:30 350|{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2757 TO 2832
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
10:00 - 12:30 250[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2832 TO 2895
12:30 - 13:00 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, FILL # 2 PUMP MOTOR WITH ANTIFREEZE
13:00-06:00 | 17.00/|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 2895 TO 3230
2/7/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3230 TO 3275
07:00 - 07:30 0.50{ RIG 2 RIG REPAIR DAY TANK ON # 2 PUMP RAN OUT OF FUEL
07:30 - 10:30 3.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3275 TO 3339
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
11:00-00:30 | 13.50{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3339 TO 3593
00:30 - 01:30 1.00{RIG 2 RIG REPAIR # 2 PUMP, REPLACED VALVE & SEAT IN SUCTION
. 01:30 - 06:00 450{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3593 TO 3664
21812007 06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3664 TO 3750
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT MIDDLE DISCHARGE VALVE AND SEAT # 1 PUMP
11:30 - 17:00 550/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3750 TO 3847
17:00 - 18:00 1.00|RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
18:00 - 19:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3847 TO 3870
19:00 - 21:00 2.00|TRP (13 PRESSURE LOSS, BIT QUIT DRILLING, LOOKING FOR PRESSURE LOSS
WENT THROUGH BOTH PUMPS
21:00 - 22:00 100/ TRP |13 MIX UP PILL
22:00 - 22:30 0.50| TRP |13 DROP SURVEY
22:30 - 23:00 0.50| TRP |13 PUMP PILL
23:00 - 01:30 250|TRP  [13 TRIP OUT FOR MOTOR
01:30 - 06:00 450|TRP |13 TWO 2" HOSES BLEW INTO BETWEEN TOP DRIVE UNIT AND 1/4 WAY UP
DERRICK, WHILE BREAKING OUT SAVER SUB TO PULL OUT HWDP
06:00 - NOTE: HAD 6 TH MAN CHANGE LINERS IN #1 PUMP TO 5 1/2
2/9/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| OTH WORKING ON TESCO TOP DRIVE, REPLACING 2" HOSES, PROBLEMS W/
BACK PRESSURE ON GRABBER
12:30 - 13:30 1.00|TRP (13 TRIP QUT TO SHOE
13:30 - 15:00 1.50| OTH WORKING ON BACKPRESSURE ON GRABBER, REPLACE CHECK VALVE
15:00 - 18:00 3.00|TRP |1 TRIP OUT , CHANGE OUT BIT AND MOTOR, CLOSE AND OPEN BLINDS, PIPES
AND HYDRIL
18:00 - 23:00 5.00|TRP |13 TRIP IN TO 1100', HIT BRIDGE, COULD NOT CIRCULATE THROUGH STRING
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csc:j:e Description of Operations
2/9/2007 23:00 - 02:00 3.00[TRP |13 TRIP OUT TO MOTOR,
02:00 - 04:00 2.00{TRP (13 FLOAT BROKE, CLEAN JUNK OUT OF MOTOR
04:00 - 05:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP IN WITH MOTOR AND IBS, CIRCULATE THROUGH BHA, GOOD
05:30 - 06:00 0.50{TRP |2 TRIP IN WITH BHA
2/110/2007  |08:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP INTO 1100
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| OTH INSTALL TRIP SLEEVE IN ROTATING HEAD
07:30 - 16:00 8.50| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 1100 TO 3183
16:00 - 17:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER,
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| REAM |1 HOLE PACKED OFF LOST CIRC, BACK REAM FROM 3207 UP TO 3200' NO
CIRCULATION
18:00 - 22:00 4.00|CIRC |2 LOST CIRC, PACKED OFF, BACK REAM FROM 3207 TO 3179, GOT RETURNS
22:00 - 01:00 3.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD
01:00 - 02:00 100|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 3780
02:00 - 04:00 2.00| REAM (1 WASH AND REAM FROM 3780 TO 3860
04:00 - 05:00 1.00| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, GO THROUGH # 2 PUMP CLEAN OUT ROCKS
05:00 - 05:30 0.50{ REAM (1 WASH AND REAM FROM 3860 TO 3870
05:30 - 06:00 050{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3870 TO 3875
2111/2007  |06:00 - 08:00 2.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3875' TO 3927
08:00 - 09:30 1.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP # 2
09:30-21:30 | 12.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 3927' TO 4164’
21:30 - 22:00 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT TWO SHAKER SCREEN ON ONE ON EACH SHAKER
22:00 - 06:00 8.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4164’ TO 4280, AT 4242' HOLE STARTED TAKING MUD
AVERAGE 65 BBL / HR. ADDED 20 SKS NEW CARB, 20 SKS MICA, 20 SKS
DYNA FIBER, AND 20 SKS ASH PHALT IN 1 HOUR 15MIN LOSSES WERE
DOWN TO 12 BBLS / HOUR
2112/2007  '06:00 - 09:00 3.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4292' TO 4326'
09:00 - 05:00 | 20.00| RIG 2 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION WHILE ATTEMPT TO REPAIRING # 2 MUD PUMP
DISCHARGE, REPAIRS FAILED CHANGED OUT DISCHARGE MODULE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4326' TO 4340’
2/13/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 5.00[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4340' TO 4379'
11:00 - 12:00 1.00|SUR |1 DROP SURVEY AT 4309' 1.5 DEG 61.20 AZI
12:00 - 19:30 750| TRP |10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE DUE TO PENETRATION RATE
19:30 - 22:00 2.50| OTH PULLED WEAR BUSHING TO CHECK WEAR, DRILL PIPE RIDING ON SIDE OF
BOPS SLIGHT WEAR ON WEAR BUSHING RE RAN WEAR BUSHING
22:00 - 02:30 450|TRP |10 MADE UP BIT # 5 SMITH MX9539 AND TRIP IN HOLE ( 1.5 HOURS TO LATCH
ONTO STAND OF 8" DRILL COLLARS )
02:30 - 04:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIPPED AND CUT DRILL LINE
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|OTH ADJUST TOP DRIVE TRACK AND ALINE BOPS WITH ROTARY TABLE
2/14/2007  |06:00 - 09:00 3.00{TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 4300
09:00 - 10:30 1.50] REAM |1 SAFETY WASH 79’ TO BOTTOM 20' OF FILL
10:30 - 14:30 4.00|{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4379 TO 4416
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SERVICE TOP DRIVE
15:00 - 17:00 200[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4416 TO 4431
17:00 - 18:00 1.00| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, REPLACE SUCTION VALVE AND SEAT IN # 1 PUMP
18:00 - 01:30 750[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4431 TO 4478
01:30 - 05:00 3.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR # 1 PUMP SUCTION VALVE AND SEAT, BULL WHEEL SIDE, ALSO
CHANGED VALVE IN DISCHARGE MIDDLE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 4478 TO 4487
2/15/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450{DRL |1 DRILLING/ 4487 TO 4500
10:30 - 13:00 2.50|RIG 2 CHANGE OUT VALVE, SEAT IN # 2PUMP CENTER POT
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER
13:30 - 14:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4500 TO 4520
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csc?dbe Description of Operations
2/15/2007 | 14:00 - 15:00 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRC, MIX , PUMP SWEEP LMC ( LOST 120 BBL. MUD )
15:00 - 18:00 3.00/DRL {1 DRILL F/ 4520 TO 4584
18:00 - 23:00 5.00/DRL |1 DRILL F/4584 TO 4619
23:00 - 00:00 1.00| RIG 2 GO THRU #2 MUD PUMP, CHANGE OUT VALVES ON SUCTION AND
DISCHARGE
00:00 - 03:00 3.00[{DRL |1 DRILL F/4619 TO 4641
03:00 - 03:30 0.50| RIG 2 WORK ON #2 PUMP, CHANGE OUT VALVES IN MIDDLE SECTION
03:30 - 06:00 250/DRL |1 DRILL F/4641 TO/
2/16/2007 | 06:00 - 10:00 400[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4671’ TO/ 4686' (LOST 100 BBLS MUD, DRAIN VALVE TO TRIP TANK
WAS LEFT OPEN)
10:00 - 13:00 3.00|REAM |1 REAMING, WORK TORQUE OUT
13:00 - 16:00 3.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD, MIX & PUMP DRY JOB
16:00 - 18:30 250|TRP {10 T.0.0.H TO HWDP, SLM 4685'
18:30 - 03:30 9.00| ISP 1 INSPECT BHA & LAY DOWN 4 JTS OF 4 1/2" HWDP
03:30 - 06:00 250|TRP |1 LAY DOWN MOTOR, SHOCK TOOL, IBS STABILIZER, BIT
2117/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP (1 LAY DOWN STABILIZER & MUD MOTOR
07:00 - 08:00 1.00|TRP |1 TRIP IN, PICK UP & REPLACE 4 JTS 4 1/2 HWDP, JARS
08:00 - 12:00 4.00|TRP |2 TIH
12:00 - 14:00 2.00| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/3254', T/3515'
14:00 - 15:00 100|TRP |2 TH
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM F/4602 T/ 4685
15:30 - 16:00 0.50[DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4685 T/ 4688
16:00 - 16:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CONDITION & CIRC, PUMP SWEEP
16:30 - 17:30 1.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4688' T/ 4701
17:30 - 18:00 0.50{SUR |1 DEVIATION SURVEY @ 4610' (1.2 DEVIATION)
18:00 - 18:30 0.50/DRL |1 DRILL F/4701 T/ 4707
18:30 - 19:00 0.50|CIRC |2 LOST CIRCULATION, 100 BBL LOSS
19:00-06:00 | 11.00|CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT SPOT, CIRC & COND MUD, JARING TIGHT HOLE @ 4693, 14FT
OFF BOTTOM
2/18/2007  |06:00 - 14:00 8.00[FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE @ 4693 UP TO 4672
14:00 - 21:30 7.50|FISH |4 RIG UP WEATHFORD WIRE LINE TRUCK TO FREE POINT
21:30 - 05:00 750(FISH |5 SPOT 300 LBS FRACK SAND IN MUD MOTOR DID NOT WORK SPOTED
300LBS SAND AGAN STILL DID NOT WORK
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE W/ ON STEEL BALL TO LOCK UP MOTOR SO WE
CAN BACK OFF
219/2007  |08:00 - 12:00 6.00|FISH |3 JARING ON STUCK PIPE, CAME FREE
12:00 - 13:00 1.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT 2 STANDS
13:00 - 14:30 150|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE, MIX & PUMP PILL, L/D FREE POINT CREW
14:30 - 18:00 350(TRP |2 T.0.0.H, LD DRILLING JARS
18:00 - 20:00 200[TRP |2 T.0.0H
20:00 - 22:00 2.00|TRP |1 L/D SHOCK SUB, MOTOR, PDC BIT, MONEL
22:00 - 23:00 1.00| RIG 1 WORK ON TOP DRIVE
23:00 - 00:00 1.00|TRP |1 P/U JUNK BASKET, MILL TOOTH BIT
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
2/20/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH 90 ' TO BOTTM 4617 TO 4707
07:00 - 07:30 0.50|FISH |5 WORK JUNK SUB ON BOTTOM PICK UP BALL , NUTS
07:30 - 08:00 050[DRL {1 DRILLING F/ 4707 TO 4718
08:00 - 08:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRC, MIX & PUMP PILL
08:30 - 12:00 350[TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE W/ JUNK SUB ( CLOSED BLIND RAMS, WORKED PIPE RAMS )
12:00 - 12:30 0.50[FISH |5 CLEAN OUT JUNK SUB ( RECOVERED 176 STEEL BALL, 76 1/4, 1/2 NUTS )
12:30 - 15:00 250|TRP |1 L/D BIT SUB, P/U MUD MOTOR, MONEL DC.
115:00 - 18:30 350[TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
£18:30 - 19:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH & REAM 30' TO BOTTOM, F/4688' T/ 4718'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Sub . .
Date From - To | Hours | Code Code Description of Operations
2/20/2007  119:00 - 21:30 250/DRL |1 DRILL F/ 4718 T/4780'
'21:30 - 22:30 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE SWAB
22:30 - 00:00 150|DRL |1 DRILL F/4780' T/4812'
00:00 - 01:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE ANOTHER SWAB
01:00 - 01:30 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL F/4812' T/4831'
01:30 - 02:00 0.50| RIG 2 COOL #2 MUD PUMP
02:00 - 06:00 400{DRL |1 DRILL F/4831' T/4913'
2/21/2007  |06:00 - 14:30 850[DRL |1 DRILL F/4913"- T/5045'
14:30 - 15:00 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON #1 MUD PUMP, CHANGE 1 DISCHARGE & 2 SUCTION
VALVES
15:00 - 16:30 150|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5045 T/5065'
16:30 - 17:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG
17:00 - 19:00 2.00|DRL |1 DRILL F/5065' T/5071"
19:00 - 19:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, COOL DOWN #1 MUD PUMP MOTOR
19:30 - 21:00 150|DRL |1 DRILL F/5071' T/ 5078', MW 9.7, 47 VIS,
121:00 - 22:30 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRC & COND MUD, FILL TRIP TANK, MIX & PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY
22:30 - 04:00 550/ TRP |10 P.0.0.H, TRIP OUT FOR BIT
04:00 - 06:00 2.00{TRP |1 L/D & P/U MOTOR & BIT
2/22/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |1 P/U BHA
07:00 - 08:30 150{TRP {10 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
08:30 - 10:00 1.50| RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE
10:00 - 13:00 3.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH TO 30 'TO BOTTOM ( BLOW BOTTOM OFF GOOD BEFOR DRLG. } NO
FILL
14:00 - 15:00 1.00{DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5078 TO 5165 (HELD BOP DRILL 2 MIN,)
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER. & SER. TOP DRIVE, ( WORK PIPE RAMS )
115:30 - 00:30 9.00[DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5165 TO 5258
00:30 - 02:00 1.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON # RIG PUMP, CHANGE
02:00 - 04:00 2.00|/DRL |1 DRILLING F/5258' T/5323
04:00 - 04:30 0.50{RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, 1 SUCTION VALVE ON #2 PUMP
04:30 - 06:00 150{DRL |1 DRILLING F/5323 T/5335
2/23/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5335 TO 5428
10:30 - 12:00 1.50| RIG 2 TURNED FAN AROUND ON # 1 & # 2 PUMPS
12:00 - 13:30 1.50|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5428 TO 5449
13:30 - 15:00 1.50| RIG 2 CHANGE SWAB IN # 2 PUMP MIDDLE POT
15.00-06:00 | 15.00|DRL |1 DRILLI F/ 5449 TO 5570
2/24/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 4.00|DRL |1 DRILLING F/ 5570 TO 5609
10:00 - 10:30 0.50| RIG 1 RIG SER. , TOP DRIVE SER.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG 2 CHANGE LINER , SWAB IN # 2 PUMP BILL WHEEL SIDE
£11:30 - 16:00 450|DRL (1 DRILLING F/ 5609 TO 5627
16:00 - 16:30 0.50{CIRC |1 CIRC COND FOR TRIP
16:30 - 17:00 050{SUR |1 SURVEY @ 5597 .5 DEG 157.6 AZ
17:00 - 17:30 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMP PILL, BLOW KELLY OUT
17:30 - 23:00 550/ TRP |10 TRIP OUT FOR BIT #9 ( HAD TRIP BOP DRILL )
23:00 - 00:00 100|TRP |1 CHANGE OUT BITS ( CLOSED BLINDS RAMS, OPEN )
00:00 - 06:00 6.00| TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE
2/25/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP {10 TRIP IN HOLE TAGED UP @4785 TITE
07:00 - 12:00 5.00{CIRC |1 WORK TITE HOLE, LOST 130 BBLS MUD, RUN STAND IN 4813
12:00 - 17:00 5.00| RIG 2 CHANGE PUMP ON TOP DRIVE
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE
17:30 - 18:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH 60 TO BOTTOM
18:00 - 19:00 100|DRL |1 DRILL F/5627 TO 5629
19:00 - 20:30 1.50| RIG 2 WORK ON # 1PUMP SWAB, #1 CHAGER PUMP SWITCH DOWN
|
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code ggg’e Description of Operations
2/25/2007  |20:30 - 21:00 050|DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5629 TO 5630
21:00 - 23:00 2.00|RIG 2 CHANGE SEAT,#1 PUMP BULL WHEEL SIDE,CHANGE SWAB MIDDLE
23:00 - 02:00 3.00{DRL |1 DRILL F/ 5630 TO 5649
02:00 - 03:00 1.00|CIRC |2 LOST CIRC @ 5649 LOST 300 BBLS.
03:00 - 04:30 150 TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE TIGHT @ 4810
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| REAM |1 BACK REAMING F/ 48 10 TO 4809
2/26/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 1.00{CIRC |2 LOST CIRC { 150 BBLS)
07:00 - 09:00 200[TRP |2 TRIP OUT 10 STAND COULDN'T CIRC TRIP TO 4750, BACK REAMING TO 4785
09:00 - 10:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP BACK IN HOLE
10:30 - 12:30 200[DRL |1 DRILL F/5649 TO 5670
12:30 - 13:30 1.00|CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE @ 5670 ON CONN.
13:30 - 23:00 9.50(DRL |1 DRILLING F/5670 TO 5732
23:00 - 00:00 1.00|CIRC |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE @ 5732 TO 5642 (3 TIMES HOLE GOOD FREE)
00:00 - 06:00 6.00/DRL |1 DRILLING 5732 TO  ( DRILL W/ NO FLUID LOST)
06:00 -
2/27/2007 | 06:00 - 09:00 3.00|DRL |1 DRILLING 5780 TO 5804
09:00 - 15:00 6.00| REAM (1 BACK REAM , JARING UP THROW TIGHT HOLE @ 5803 TO 5700
15:00 - 15:30 0.50| RIG 2 CHANGE OUT GRABBER DIES IN TOP DRIVE
15:30 - 18:00 250|TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE TO 3127 TIGHT
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| REAM |1 WORK TIGHT HOLE F/ 3127 TO 3072 ( 55
2/28/2007 | 06:00 - 09:00 3.00|FISH |3 WORKING TIGHT HOLE JARING UP ( 3272, 3464 PULLED 1 STD TIGHT AGAIN
3400 JARED OUT TO 3369
09:00 - 14:00 500{TRP |2 TRIP OUT HOLE
14:00 - 17:00 300{TRP |1 L/D BHA. BIT, MM, JARS, AND STAB
17:00 - 22:00 500{TRP |1 TRIP IN HOLE, TIGHT HOLE AT 3257' WORKED PIPE
22:00 - 02:00 4.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND RAISE MUD WEIGHT TO 9.7 AT 3077
02:00 - 03:00 1.00|TRP |1 LOST RETURNS PULLED 2 STANDS
03:00 - 05:30 2.50[CIRC |1 PUMP 2 50 LCM PILL AND CIRC
05:30 - 06:00 050[TRP |1 TiH.
3/1/2007 06:00 - 07:30 150 TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASHING TO BOTTOM LOST GIRC.
08:00 - 08:30 050|TRP |2 TRIP OUT 10 STD.
08:30 - 10:00 150|CIRC |1 MIX UP LCM PILL, PUMP
10:00 - 14:00 4.00|CIRC |2 CIRC, BUILD MUD VOLUME
14:00 - 15:30 150 TRP |2 TOOH TO 3130’ TIGHT HOLE FROM 3250° TO 3130°
15:30 - 19:00 350|CIRC |2 CIRC GOOD RETURNS REAM THROUGH TIGHT SPOT, BUILD VOLUME
19:00 - 21:00 200|TRP |2 TIH BROKE CIRC EVERY 5 STANDS
21:00 - 06:00 9.00|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5804’ TO 5889’
3/2/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5889' TO 5895'
13:00 - 14:00 1.00{CIRC |1 PUMP PILL, CHANGE PLAN GO BACK TO DRILLING
14:00 - 15:30 150|DRL |1 DRILLING NO PROGRESS
15:30 - 18:00 250/DRL |1 MADE AND PUMPED BIT UNBALLING PILL WHILE ATTEMPTING TO DRILL NO
PROGRESS
18:00 - 00:00 6.00[ TRP |10 TOOH TIGHT HOLE AT 5800' BACK REAMED THROUGH TIGHT SPOT AND
TOOH NO OTHER PROBLEMS
00:00 - 06:00 6.00[ TRP |10 M/U NEW BIT RIH FILLEDPIPE EVERY 6 STANDS AFTER 3200 FOOT
3/3/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00|TRP |10 TRIP IN HOLE BRAKE CIRC EVERY 5 STAND
07:00 - 08:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM TO 5801
08:00 - 10:30 2.50| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMPS # 1 CHANGED OUT SWAB AND SEAT # 2 PUMP
CHANGED OUT SWAB
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| REAM |1 WASH REAM FROM 5801’ TO 5895'
11:00 - 11:30 0.50{CIRC |1 PUMP 40 BBLS OF UNBALLING PILL
11:30 - 12:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5895' TO 5901'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
3/3/2007 12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR PUMP # 2 CHANGED SWAB
12:30-03:30 | 15.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 5901' TO 6014'
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR PUMP #2 CHANGED SWAB
04:00 - 06:00 200[DRL |1 DRILL F/6014' T/ 6041’
3/4/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR MUD PUMP # 2 CHANGED SWAB AND VALVE
07:00 - 08:30 150|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6041’ TO 6067"
08:30 - 09:30 1.00| REAM |1 TIGHT HOLE WORK PIPE WASHED AND REAMED TIGHT HOLE AT 6000'
09:30 - 13:00 350|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6067 TO 6107°
13:00 - 14:00 100|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
14:00 - 18:30 450| TRP |14 SHORT TRIP INTO SHOE, SLM
18:30 - 20:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRLG. LINE
20:00 - 23:30 3.50| TRP |14 SHORT TRIP TO BOTTOM
23:30 - 02:00 250[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION, MIX PILL FOR DRY JOB, FILL TRIP TANK
02:00 - 02:30 0.50{SUR |1 DROP SURVEY TOOL, SURVEY @ 6068'
02:30 - 03:00 0.50| TRP |2 TRIP OUT
03:00 - 04:00 1.00| RIG 2 REPAIR TOP DRIVE HOSE
04:00 - 06:00 2.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT
3/5/2007 06:00 - 08:00 200|TRP |2 TOOH, TO RUN 9 5/8 CASING
08:00 - 09:30 1.50|TRP |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE
09:30 - 12:30 3.00/TRP |1 LAYED DOWN 6 5/8 HWDP, 8 " DRILL COLLARS MONEL, AND MOTOR
RETRIVED SURVEY DEPTH 6068 DEG. .9 AZI 149
12:30 - 13:30 1.00| OTH RETRIVED, WEAR BUSHING
13:30 - 15:00 150|csG |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING RIGGING UP CASING CREW, FILL UP TOOL, AND
STABING BOARD
15:00-03:00 | 12.00{CSG |2 RUN 140 JTS, 9 5/8 CASING 47#FT, HCP-110, LT&C
03:00 - 03:30 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION, LOST CIRCULATION @ 3300', 55 STKS 194GPM,
MW-9.8, VIS 43, 7% LCM
03:30 - 04:30 1.00{CMT |1 R/U HALLIBURTON TO CEMENT, SAFETY MEETING
04:30 - 06:00 1.50{cMT |2 CEMENTING 9 5/8 CASING
3/6/2007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50{CMT |2 CEMENTING
LEAD- 842 SK, CBM- LIGHT, 10.5 PPG, YIELD 4.14, F/ 3000" T/5100'
TAIL- 585 SK, 50- 50 POZ, 14.35 PPG, YIELD 1.25, F/5100' T/ 6100°
BUMPED PLUG- @ 9AM 3-5-07, FLOAT HELD @ 3000PSI, RELEASED
PRESSURE
09:30 - 10:00 0.50{BOP |1 FINISH N/D BOP AND FLOW LINE
10:00 - 12:00 2.00{csGg |7 SET SLIPS, CAMERON ROUGH CUT CASING, SET @ 280K
12:00 - 14:00 2.00{BOP |1 4 BOLT BOP TO L/D DRILL PIPE
14:00 - 15:00 1.00{CSG |1 L/D & CHANGE OUT ELEVATORS & BAILS
15:00 - 18:00 3.00[TRP |2 TRIP IN TO L/D DRILL PIPE, INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
18:00 - 20:00 200{TRP |3 R/U L/D MACHINE & LAY DOWN PIPE
120:00 - 21:30 150|TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE
21:30- 01:30 400|TRP |3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, RIG DOWN L/D TRUCK
01:30 - 06:00 450{BOP |1 N/D BOP
3/7/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00{BOP |1 FINISH NIPPLE DOWN STACK
07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |7 FINISH CLEANING PITS, LAY DOWN TESCO TOP DRIVE, INSTALL B SECTION
& NITE CAP, LOADING OUT RENTALS
3/8/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00|LOC |4 CLEAN TANKS,RIG DOWN & LOAD OUT TOP DRIVE & RENTALS
3/9/2007 07:00-18:00 | 11.00|/LOC |4 LOAD OUT RENTALS, INSPECTING DRILL PIPE
3/10/2007  [07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |4 INSPECTING DRILL PIPE 233 JTS.
3/11/2007  |07:00-18:00 | 11.00{LOC |4 PREPARING TO MOVE, FINISH INSPECTING DRILL PIPE 349 JTS. 3 BENT JTS.
3/12/2007  |08:00-18:00 | 10.00{LOC |4 LAY DERRICK DOWN, LOAD OUT 7 TRUCKS
4/1/2007 06:00-18:00 | 12.00/LOC |3 ENSIGN 24-RIG DOWN AND MOVE CAMPS TO LOCATION/RIG UP SAME,
HAUL TUBULARS IN, OTHER LOCATION 60% RIGGED DOWN AND 40% OFF
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R
4- 8-S 22-E 26

Location:
Rig Name:

ENSIGN

Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Number: 24

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

4/1/2007

4/2/2007

4/3/2007

4/4/2007

4/5/2007

4/6/2007

41712007

06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00
06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00
06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00
06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00
06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00

06:00 - 18:00

18:00 - 06:00

06:00 - 09:00

09:00 - 06:00

12.00

12.00
12.00

12.00
12.00

12.00
12.00

12.00
12.00

12.00

12.00

12.00

3.00

21.00

LoC

OTH
LoC

OTH
LOC

OTH
LOC

LoC
LoC

LOC

LoC

LoC

LOC

OTH

LOCATION (BACK YARD IS MOVED OUTYHARD BANDING BHA/HAVE 4 LOADS
OF TUBULARS STILL ON OLD LOCATION.

WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

RIG DOWN DERRICK, SUB, MOTOR PACKAGE, 100% RIGGED DOWN AND
100% OFF OLD LOCATION, SET MATTING BOARDS AND BOTTOM SUB, ALL 6"
BHA IS HARD BANDED, (RING GROOVE ON SINGLE GATE HAS STUD
MARKINGS-FLARED OUT)Y MONTORING BACK SIDE-GAINING250 EVERY
HALF HOUR AND BLEEDING IT OFF.

WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

SET IN SUBS, MOTOR PACKAGE, MUD TANKS, PUMPS, HOPPER HOUSE,
PUT DERRICK TOGETHER, LIGHT PLANT, MUD CLEANING EQUIPMENT, BAR
HOPPERS, PREMIX TANK 80% SET IN 25% RIGGED UP, BLEEDING
PRESSURE OFF OF LAST WELL EVERY HALF HOUR UNTIL 1900-LETTING
PRESSURE BUILD WHILE MONITORING.NOT TO EXCEED 5,000 PSI

WAIT ON DAY LIGHT/ LETTING WELL BUILD UP PRESSURE

GET DERRICK READY AND PUT ON FLOOR, PUT COMPOUND TOGHETHER,
SET IN GAS BUSTER LINES/EQUIPMENT, DIESEL TANKS, FIRE LIGHT PLANT,
WELD HOLES IN MUD TANKS (BAD SHAPE), STRING CORDS, HOOKING UP
LINES/PUMP SHED AND BACK YARD. STRING UP DERRICK (LOAED OUT 105
JT'S DRILL PIPE 4" XT 39 TO RIG 236)

WAIT ON DAY LIGHT

BROKE TOUR TODAY, INSPECT DERRICK TO RAISE AND RAISE DERRICK,
RIG UP FLOOR TUGGER AND INSTAL HAND RAILS, UNBRIDLE, LAY DOWN
PART OF TRACK THAT WAS BENT FROM LAST WELL,SET IN YELLOW DOG,
FILL PITS WITH WATER, CHANGING OIL IN MUD PUMP, HOOK UP STAND
PIPE, THERE WAS HANDS STANDING AROUND WATCHING OTHER HANDS
ON A JOB THAT SHOULD ONLY TAKE TWO HANDS TO DO. GOT WITH
PUSHER AND TOLD HIM THAT HE NEED TO SEPARATE HANDS, ONTO
DIFFERENT TASK'S. SO HE STARTED SEPARATING THE HANDS AND
PUTTING THEM ON DIFFERNT TASK'S.

RIG UP WET SYSTEM ON BAR HOPPER'S,HOOK UP CHOKE LINE, KILL LINE,
CHANGE SWABS,LINERS (SHORT TWO BE HERE THIS AM) RIG UP RETURN
LINE ON GAS BUSTER, DRESS SHAKER'S, PUT CULVERT IN FOR MOUSE
HOLE

STACK ANNULAR, ROTATING HEAD, CHANGE LINERS/CHANGED PONY ROD
SEAL'S IN #1 PUMP, PICK UP TOP DRIVE RAIL AND CENTER RAIL TIGHTEN
TURN BUCKLES,INSTALL LANDING AROUND BOPE,PUT IN MOUSE
HOLES-HAD PROBLEMS GETTING THE FRONT ONE IN BUT MANAGED
TO,(NOTIFIED STONY WITH BLM THAT WE'LL BE TESTING IN THE NEXT
24HR.S), PICK UP SWIVEL, BIULT TROUGH ON BACK SIDE OF PITS TO
DIVERT FLUID TO RESERVE PIT.

PICK UP NEW TOP DRIVE (OLD ONE UP FOR SERVICE) HOOK UP TORQUE
TUBE GUIDE (DONT HAVE THE RIGHT CONNECTION BETWEEN SWIVEL AND
TOP DRIVE (TOP DRIVE HAS NC 61 THREAD INSTEAD OF A 6 5/8 REG) RUN
TOP DRIVE HOSES FIRE UP UNIT AND HOSES LEAKING EVERY WHERE IN
NEW TOP DRIVE (NEW TOP DRIVE HAND FIRST TIME RIGGING UP BY HIM
SELF-LITTLE LOST), FINALY FINISHED LINERS IN PUMPS, FLOW LINE OFF 5"
(WELDER ON HIS WAY),

CHANGED VALVE IN FLOW LINE, WELD FLOW LINE,LAY OUT AND MAKE UP
FLARE LINES, WORK ON SMALL LEAK'S IN GUN LINES,READY TO PRESSURE
TEST @ 900AM

WORKING ON TOP DRIVE (NEW HAND THAT IT WAS HIS FIRST TIME
RIGGING UP TOP DRIVE PRESSURED UP UNIT AND BLEW OIL ALL OVER
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location:  4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24

Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
4/7/2007 09:00- 06:00 | 21.00| OTH DIDN'T KNOW WHAT WAS WRONG, JOHN THE HAND THATS BEEN SITTING

ON THIS RIG SHOWED UP TODAY AND SUFPT. BILL AND ANOTHER HAND.
THEY TESTED LINES AND FOUND CHECK VALVE BAD AND SEALS BLOWN IN
TOP DRIVE, PULL MOTORS AND REPLACE SEALS

4/8/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00|OTH WORK ON TOP DRIVE, FINISH PUTTING IN MOTOR AND TEST LINES AND
OPERATIONS OF UNIT ALL WORKING CORRECTLY (TORQUE ALL
CONNECTION'S)
10:00 - 14:00 4.00| BOP 1 IPS TIGHTENED CONNECTIONS ON BOPE
14:00 - 00:00 10.00| BOP 2 RIG UP AND PRESSURE TEST TOP DRIVE DOUBLE BALL VALVE DIDN'T TEST

CHANGED DOUBLE BALL VALVE AND IT DIDN'T TEST,TEST THIRD VALVE
TEST TIW, DART VALVE, BLIND, UPPER AND LOWER PIPES, CHOKE
MANIFOLD AND HCR 10 MIN LOW 250 PSI HIGH 10,000 PSI ANNULAR 10 MIN
LOW 250 PSI HIGH 5000 PSI,BLM WAS NOTIFIED BY MESSAGE ON PHONE
(BLM WAS NOT PRESENT FOR TEST) WHILE TESTING MUDDING UP
SURFACE SYSTEM

00:00 - 05:00 5.00|RIG 2 CLEAN RIG FLOOR OF OIL AND REPLACE DRIVE CHAIN ON DRAWWORKS
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING/ WHEN ISTALLING DRILLER TOLD MOTOR HAND
TO MAKE SURE KOOMY LEVERS WHERE IN THE OPEN POSTION, BUT THE
HCR, WHEN | DISCOVERED THE PROBLEM ALL KOOMY LEVERS WHERE IN
THE OPEN POSTION BUT THE ANNULAR IT WAS SHUT

4/9/2007 ‘06100 -07.00 1.00{ OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING, COULDN'T COME OUT OF THE HOLE WITH WEAR
; BUSHING, LOOK OVER EQUIPMENT AND HYDRILL WAS SHUT, DRILLER

‘ TOLD HAND TO OPEN EVERY THING BUT TO SHUT HCR VALVE, HE SHUT
THE WRONG VALVE, | DISCUSSED WITH DRILLER AND HANDS NOT TO BE
OPERATING FUNTIONS WHILE INSTALLING WEAR BUSHING.

07.00 - 08:00 1.00| TRP 1 RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK, TO PICK UP DRILL PIPE

08.00 - 08:30 0.50(RIG 2 REPLACE MAKE UP SIDE CABLE, BROKE WHEN MAKING UP BIT

08:30 - 16:00 6.50| TRP 1 RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE AND PICK UP BHA AND 3260' OF 5" DRILL PIPE,
TAGGED EARLY AT 4460" THAT IS 1539' ABOVE THE FLOAT SHOE

15:00 - 16:00 1.00| CSG 1 RIG DOWN LAY DOWN TRUCK

16:00 - 17:00 1.00( OTH FILE UNION STARTER THREAD (IT CAME FROM THE REPAIR SHOP WITH
OUT ANY PROTECTION ON IT) AND PICK UP KELLY HOSE AND PUT ON
SWIVEL

17:00 - 18:30 1.50| RIG 2 WORK ON AIR LINES BETWEEN MOTOR SHED'S/ SOME CROSSED LINES
WHEN #3 MOTOR CLUTCH KICKS IN #2 PUMP COMES ON LINE/ WHEN KICK
IN #2 PUMP ENGINE'S THOTTLE UP

18:30 - 19:30 1.00|CIRC (1 FILL PIPE PRESSURED UP AND NO CIRCULATION

19:30 - 22:00 2.50{ TRP 2 TRIP QUT OF HOLE (WET)

22:00 - 23:30 1.50| OTH CLEAN RIG FLOOR AFTER WET TRIP AND DRIED MUD FROM DRILL PIPE
PACK OFF ON TOP OF MUD MOTOR AND FIRST IBS, BREAK BIT AND CLEAN
OUT PLUG JETS (PLUGGED WITH CEMENT)

23:30 - 00:00 0.50| TRP 2 TRIP IN FIRST STAND AND STAND WITH X-OVER AND PUMP TO SEE IF
MOTOR WAS CLEAN (MOTOR WAS GOOD)

00:00 - 01:30 1.50( TRP 2 TRIP INTO HOLE TO DRILL OUT CEMENT, BREAK CIRC AFTER BHA

01:30 - 02:00 0.50| OTH CHANGE GRABBER DIES IN TOP DRIVE

02:00 - 03:00 1.00| TRP 2 TRIP IN 3 ROWS

03:00 - 04:00 1.00(OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER

04:00 - 04:30 0.50| RIG WORK ON SWIVEL PACKING (LEAKING HAD TO HAMMER UP)

04:30 - 05:00 0.50| CIRC BREAK CIRCULATION

TRIP IN 3 STANDS

WASHING AND REAMING CEMENT IN CASING FROM 4460 TO 4501

DRILLING CEMENT FROM 4,501 TO 5251 (CEMENT WIPER PLUG WAS @4540)
CEMENT COMING OVER SHAKERS CLUMPY 1/2-1" CHUNKS (HARD)

05:00 - 05:30 0.50| TRP
05:30 - 06:00 0.50| REAM
4/10/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00| REAM

S N =N
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code gc:jdbe Description of Operations
4/10/2007  {10:00 - 11:00 1.00|RIG 1 RIG SERVICE GREASE TOP DRIVE AND DRAW TOOL, COMPOUND
14:00 - 20:00 9.00| OTH DRILL CEMENT FROM 5251 TO 6120 @ 5715 SANDY CEMENT STARTED
COMING OVER SHAKERS (SOFT)
20:00 - 20:30 0.50[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN FOR FIT TEST
20:30 - 21:00 0.50| OTH PERFORM FIT WITH 8.8 MUD WT 850 PSI = EQUIV. 11.5 MUD WTWITHB&C
QUICK TEST
21:00 - 01:00 400lDRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6120 TO 6241 (ROP 30.25)
01:00 - 02:30 1.50{ RIG 2 WORK ON #1- ROD CLAMP AND #2 PUMP- COULDN'T GET TO PUMP AIRED
UP/ WENT THROUGH PUMP TO SEE IF THERE WAS SOMING UNDER VALVE
COULDN'T FIND ANYTHING
02:30 - 06:00 350[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6241 TO 6295 (ROP 15.4)
4/11/2007  |06:00 - 14:30 8.50|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 6295 TO 6474 (ROP 21 HR.) (10-15 WOB, 50 TABLE, PUMPING
BIT UNBALLING SWEEP'S WHEN NEEDED AND TRICKLE NUT SHELL OVER
SUCTION IN TANK, ALSO ON CONNECTIONS DROPPING SOAP STICKS AND
SAPP/ SOFT GUMMY CLAY COMING OVER SHAKERS)
14:30 - 15:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG
15:30-06:00 | 14.50/ DRL |1 DRILL FROM 8474 TO 6775 (ROP 20.75' HR)
4/12/2007 | 06:00 - 09:30 350[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 6775 - 6850', 75', 21.42 FPH, 19K WOB, 92 RPM DOWM HOLE,
50 RPM ON SURFACE. HELD STAND DOWN SAFETY MEETING ON 3
ACCIDENTS ON QEP LOCATIONS.
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION LOWER PIPE RAMS
10:30 - 14:30 400|DRL |1 DRILL 6850' - 6945', 95', 23.75 FPH, 19K WOB, 92 RPM DH, 50 RPM ON
SURFACE. PUMPING LCM & BIT BALLNG SWEEPS AS NEEDED. CEMENTED
BASE PLATE ON WELL HEAD W/ 5 YDS OF REDIMIX FROM PETE MARTIN.
14:30 - 15:30 1.00{SUR |1 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 6874', .5 DEG. @ 147.4
15:30-06:00 | 14.50/DRL |1 DRILL 6945' - 7351, 406", 28 FPH, WOB 15-20K, 92 RPM DOWN HOLE, 50 RPM
ON SURFACE, STILL PUMPING LCM & BIT BALLING SWEEPS AS NEEDED.
TOTAL LOSSES TODAY 200 BBL.
4/13/2007  |06:00 - 12:00 6.00{DRL |1 DRILL 7351' - 7508', 157", 26.16 FPH, WOB 15-20K, 92 RPM DOWN HOLE, 50
RPM ON MOTOR. SLIGHT 8IT BALLING, NO NOTICEABLE LOSSES SO FAR
TODAY.
12:00 - 13:00 1.00{SUR |1 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 7438', .6 DEG. 202.
13:00 - 16:30 350|DRL |1 DRILL 7508' - 7603', 95', 27.14 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWN HOLE.
16:30 - 17:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
17:30-06:00 | 1250(DRL |1 DRILL 7603' - 7905, 302", 24.16 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWN HOLE. TOTAL LOSSES TODAY 125 BBL. SLIGHT SEEPAGE HOLE IN
GOOD CONDITION. ONLY SMALL SLOUGH & VERY LITTLE OF THAT.
4/14/2007 | 06:00 - 09:00 3.00{DRL |1 DRILL 7905' - 7983', 78', 26 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE & 91
DOWN HOLE. MINIMAL SEEPAGE, NO INCREASE IN SLOUGH.
09:00 - 10:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
10:00 - 15:00 5.00|DRL |1 DRILL 7983 - 8076', 93', 18.6 FPH, WOB 15-21K, RPM 50 ON SURFACE, 91
DOWN HOLE. TOTAL LOSSES TO TRIP = 185 BBL, SEEPAGE & DUMPING
SAND TRAPS.
15:00 - 19:30 450(TRP |10 PUMP PILL & TOH W/ BIT #13.
19:30 - 20:30 1.00{TRP {10 BREAK OFF BIT, PU NEW BIT, FUNCTION BLIND RAMS
20:30 - 00:00 3.50|TRP |10 TIH W/ BIT #14, CHANGE OUT CORROSION RING. GOOD TRIP.
00:00 - 00:30 0.50| REAM {1 W&R 90' TO BOTTOM, 10" OF FILL, LOST 30 BBL ON TRIP. 10 BBL OF IT WET
PIPE.
00:30 - 06:00 550/ DRL  [1 DRILL 8076' - 8280, 204", 37.09 FPH, WOB 11-15K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWN HOLE. VERY SLIGHT SEEPAGE.
4/15/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL  [1 DRILL 8280' - 8453, 173", 38.44 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE &
91 DOWN HOLE, NO NOTICEABLE LOSSES AS OF YET. VERY LITTLE
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Weli Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
4/15/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 SLOUGH.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE. FUNCTION LOWER PIPE RAMS.
11:30-06:00 | 18.50|DRL |1 DRILL 8453 - 8818', 365', 19.72 FPH, WOB 15-20k, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWN HOLE. PUMPING BIT BALLING SWEEPS @ 1/2 - 1 HR INTERVALS
SOME TIMES IT HELPS BUT ONLY FOR 3-4'. VERY SLIGHT SEEPAGE LAST 24
HRS.
4/16/2007 | 06:00 - 10:00 400|DRL |1 DRILL 8818' - 8932, 114', 28.5 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 141, 50 ON SURFACE,
91 DOWNHOLE. STILL PUMPING BIT BALLING SWEEPS @ 1/2- 1 HR
INTREVALS. SEEPAGE MINIMAL
10:00 - 11:00 1.00|RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION ANNULAR & CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC
11:00-06:00 | 19.00|DRL |1 DRILL 8932 - 9511', 579", 30.47 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,
100 DOWN HOLE INCREASED PUMPS TO 418 GPM. VERY SLIGHT SEEPAGE.
4/17/2007  |06:00 - 09:30 350[DRL |1 DRILL 9511’ - 9608', 97", 27.71 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,
100 DOWN HOLE. BIT JUST KEEPS HANGING IN. SEEPAGE MINIMAL.
09:30 - 10:00 0.50{ RIG 2 CHANGE FILTER ON CHAIN OILER ON COMPOUND.
10:00 - 12:30 250|DRL |1 DRILL 9608' - 9704', 96", 38.4 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURVACE, 100
DOWN HOLE
12:30 - 13:30 1.00|RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, ADJUST BRAKES, ADD SAFETY CHAINS TO BALE
EXTENSION, & FUNCTION LOWER PIPE RAMS.
13:30-06:00 | 16.50|DRL |1 DRILL 9704' - 10200, 496", 30.06 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,
100 DOWN HOLE. HOLE TAKING A LITTLE MORE FLUID THE LAST 3 HRS,
ABOUT 10 BBL. PUMPED 10% LCM SWEEP, STILL PUMPING BIT BALLING
SWEEP EVERY HALF HR SINCE 22:00. FIRST TIGHT CONN @ 10181’ ABOUT
25K OVER. REAMED BACK THROUGH IT AND DIDN'T SEE IT.
4/18/2007 | 06:00 - 09:30 350|DRL |1 DRILL 10200’ - 10342, 142, 40.6 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 150, 50 ON SURFACE,
100 DOWN HOLE, TRIPPING BIT ON HOURS ONLY.
09:30 - 10:30 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP.
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 DROP SURVEY @ 10362' .6 202, SAME AS LAST SURVEY. DRILLER CHECKED
SURVEY. WHEN | CHECKED 1T IT WAS 89.6 @ 68.9, POSSIBLE MIS-RUN. |
THINK IT TOOK A SURVEY ON THE BENCH, BUT CAN'T TELL FOR SURE.
11:00 - 18:00 7.00|TRP |10 PUMP PILL, TOH W/ BIT #14, PULL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER, BREAK OFF
BIT, LD MUD MOTOR.
18:00 - 19:00 1.00[TRP |10 PU NEW BIT # 15, NEW MOTOR, & TIH TO JARS. JARS HAD TOP SEAL OUT OF
MANDREL, LD JARS. #1 4/17/07
19:00 - 20:00 1.00|RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE, 180’
20:00 - 21:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, TOP DRIVE, & FUNCTION ANNULAR
21:00 - 22:00 1.00|WOT |5 WO, STRAP & PU JARS. #2 4/17/07
22:00 - 03:30 550| TRP (10 TIH, BREAK CIRC AT BHA, & EA. 3 ROWS TO BOTTOM 1 STAND OFF BOTTOM
TIGHT, PACKED OFF.
03:30 - 05:00 1.50|FISH |6 WORK TIGHT HOLE, SET OFF JARS 3 TIMES EASY, FOUND FREE SPOT,
BREAK CRC. BACK REAM OUT TO 10208'
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{ REAM |1 W&R 10208’ - 10300
4/19/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| REAM (1 W&R 10300 - 10342, 36' OF FILL,LOTS OF PRESSURED SLOUGH BUT
NOTHING LARGE.
07:00 - 12:00 500[DRL |1 DRILL 10342' - 10541°, 199, 39.8 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 124, 65 ON SURFACE,
59 DOWN HOLE. NO NOTICABLE SEEPAGE TO THIS POINT. BOP DRILL.
12:00 - 13:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION PIPE RAMS
13:00 - DRL |1 DRILL 10541' - 11060, 519", 30.52 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 110, 50 ON
SURFACE, 60 DOWN HOLE, NO NOTICEABLE SEEPAGE LAST 24
HRS.PUMPING BIT BALLING SWEEPS IN SLOW DRILLING SPOTS.
4/20/2007 | 06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 DRILL 11060 - 11207', 147", 32.66 FPH, WOB 15 - 20K, RPM 110, 50 ON
SURFACE, 60 DOWN HOLE, NO NOTICEABLE SEEPAGE TO THIS POINT.
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24

Date From - To | Hours | Code CS(;‘dbe Description of Operations

4/20/2007 10:30 - 11:30 1.00| RIG SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION ANNULAR, ADJUST BRAKES.

11:30 - 14:00 2.50| DRL 1 DRILL 10207' - 11301, 94", 37.6 FPH, WOB 15-20, RPM 100, 50 ON SURFACE,
60 DOWN HOLE, TOP DRIVE WILL NOT TURN OVER 50 RPM ON SURFACE. IT
WILL TURN 70 OFF BOTTOM BUT FALLS TO 50 WHEN YOU PUT IT ON

-

BOTTOM.
14:00 - 18:00 4.00{RIG 8 REPLACE AIR VALVE & LINDE PUMP ON TOP DRIVE.
18:00 - 05:00 11.00| DRL 1 DRILL 11301’ - 11488', 187", 17 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 120, 60 DOWN HOLE, 60

ON SURFACE. HOLE STARTED TAKING FLIUD @ 11380', SHOW 11382’ - 11400’
600u, 6637u, 3800u. TRIED TO GO THROUGH BUSTER BUT ROTATING HEAD

LEAKING BAD.

05:00 - 06:00 1.00| RIG 4 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD, SEAL GONE WHEN WE PULLED HEAD,
DON'T THINK ONE WAS INSTALLED AFTER LAST TRIP.

4/21/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL 11488' - 11564, 73', 24.33 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 119, 60 ON SURFACE,

59 DOWN HOLE. ROTATIG HEAD LOCKED UP, WORE RUBBER OUT.

09:00 - 10:00 1.00{ RIG 4 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD RUBBERS.

10:00 - 13:00 3.00{ DRL 1 DRILL 11561' - 11614, 53', 17.66 FPH, WOB 15-20K, RPM 119, 60 ON
SURFACE, 59 DOWN HOLE. LOSSES SEEM TO BE SLOWING.

13:00 - 14:00 1.00{ RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE.

14:00 - 00:30 10.50| DRL 1 DRILL 11614 - 11724 110,10.47 FPH, WOB 20-25K, RPM 119, 60 ON SURFACE,

59 DOWN HOLE. LOOSING ABOUT 2-4 BBL HR OF FLUID, RAISING MW TO
CONTROL GAS, DRILLING FLARE 15-25', CONN FLARE 35’

00:30 - 06:00 5.50| CIRC 1 DRILLING SLOWED TO 4 FPH, SHUT DOWN TO RAISE MW F/ BIT TRIP. BBG
THROUGH BUSTER 1500 - 2500u MW 10.2, HEADED F/ 10.4. BYPASSED
SHAKERS TO KEEP LCM IN SYSTEM.

4/22/2007 06:00 - 23:30 17.50| CIRC 1 C&C F/ BIT TRIP. MW HEADED F/ 10.2 - 10.8. GAS @ 10.8 IS STILL 725u
THROUGH THE BUSTER, SPOTTED 160 BBL OF 12.2PPG MUD ON BOTTOM.
ESTIMATE TOP OF PILL @ 9981"

23:30 - 01:00 150[TRP |10 TOH 22 STANDS SLOW & WET. TO 9653, GAINED 8 BBL OF FLUID PULLING 22
! STANDS.
:01:00 - 04:00 300|CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP TO CLEAN UP GAS. GAS ON BUSTER 650u. MIXED PILL
WHILE CIRC.
04:00 - 06:00 2.00/CIRC {1 CHECK F/ FLOW, FLOWING 1/2" STREAM, RAISING MW TO 11.0 PPG.
4/23/2007  |06:00-00:00 | 18.00|CIRC |1 C&C, RAISING MW F/ 10.8 - 11.8, HAD 11.7 COMMING BACK & LOST
COMPLETE RETURNS @ 23:49 LCM 12%
00:00 - 01:00 100|CIRC |2 MIXING LCM & MUD, LETTING MW DROP BACK TO 11.7 BRINGING LCM TO
15%
01:00 - 06:00 5.00|CIRC |1 C&C, BUILD VOLUME, WT @ 11.7, LCM @ 20%, LOSSES @ 17 BPH, SEEM TO
BE SLOWING A LITTLE, AROUND 7 BPH AS NEAR AS | CAN TELL AT THIS
TIME.
4/24/2007  |06:00 - 13:30 750{CIRC |1 C&C, MIXING MUD & BUILD VOLUME. CHECKED FLOW @ 08:00, NO FLOW.

C&C BUILD PREMIX, GUN LINES PLUGGED OFF, & BAR HOPPER @ PREMIX
PLUGGING @ 4X3" SAWGE. CHECKED F/ FLOW @ 11:15, FLOWING 1"
STREAM & SURGING TO 4" -6" STREAM FIRST TIME WE HAVE SEEN THIS
SURGING. TAKING PREMIX TO 12.2 PPG W/ 30% LCM.

13:30 - 14:00 0.50| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, FUNCTION HCR VALVE, CHECK FLOW, NO
FLOW. 11.8PPG MW.

14:00 - 18:00 4.00| CIRC 1 C&C, BUILD PREMIX, 12.2 PPG MW, 30% LCM & SPOT F/ 9653’ - 6745'
CALCULATED OH.

18:00 - 03:30 9.50| TRP 10 TOH TO 6107, PUMP TRIP PILL. CONTINUE W/ SLOW TOH, LD BIT & MOTOR.
NO LOSSES ON TOH.

03:30 - 06:00 2.50| TRP 10 PU HUNTING .22 MOTOR SN 6142 , DOG SUB, HTC 406Z BIT SN 7301750 BIT
#16, & TIH SLOW
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24

Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations

4/25/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50| TRP 10 TiH SLOW,BREAK CIRC EVERY 3 ROWS TO SHOE

08:30 - 09:00 0.50| TRP 10 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD

09:00 - 10:00 1.00| CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @ THE SHOE, GAS PEAKED @ 4899u, 10-15°
FLARE.

10:00 - 16.00 6.00| TRP 10 TIH CIRCULATING BOTTOMS UP EVERY ROW , BOTTOMS UP FLARE ON
LAST ROW 40 + 44 BBL GAIN.

16:00 - 17:00 1.00|REAM |1 W&R 470' TO BOTTOM, 36' OF FILL BOTTOMS UP FLARE 50', GAINED 55 BBL.

17:00 - 18:00 1.00| CIRC 1 CIRC OUT GAS.

18:00 - 06:00 12.00{ DRL 1 DRILL 11724' - 11839', 115", WOB 18-25K, RPM 142, 92 DOWN HOLE, 50 ON
SURFACE NO LOSSES THIS MORNING. MW 12.0, LCM 25% STILL BY PASSING
SHAKERS.

4/26/2007 06.00 - 12:30 6.50| DRL 1 DRILL 11839' - 11867', 28',4.3 FPH, WOB 25K, RPM 142, 92 DOWN HOLE, 50 ON

SURFACE. PLAYED W/ RPM & WOB BUT THATS ALL WE COULD GET OUT OF
THIS BIT.

12:30-13:30 1.00{ SUR 1 DROP SURVEY @ 11797 (MISS RUN)

13:30 - 14:30 1.00!{ CIRC 1 CIRC & FINISH MIXING TRIP PILL.

14:30- 18.00 3.50| TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE SLOW

18:00 - 21:00 3.00| TRP 1 TRIP OUT OF HOLE

21:00 - 21:30 0.50| TRP 1 CHANGE OUT BIT'S/ RETREIVE SURVEY/ FUNTION TEST BLINDS AND PIPE
RAMS

21:30 - 02:00 4.50| TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE, FILL EVERY 3 ROWS, INSTALL ROT. RUBBER

02:00 - 02:30 0.50| CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @ SHOE 110 PEAK GAS

02:30 - 05:30 3.00| TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE FILL PIPE AND BREAK CIRCULATION 8785,10,794

05:30 - 06:00 0.50| CIRC 1 CIRCULATE/ WASH @ 10,794

4/27/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00| TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 11744
07:00 - 08:00 1.00| REAM |1 WASH AND REAM FROM 11,744 TO 11,867 25 FT FILL
08:00 - 13.00 5.00{ DRL 1 DRILL FROM 11,867 TO 11,924 (ROP 11.4) (STARTED SHAKIING OUT LCM

SLOWLY OVER 1 SHAKER @ 10:30 am) MW 11.7/GAS 180 UNIT'S/ ON
CONNECTION WORKED THROUGH TIGHT SPOT @ 11,890 UP TO 11,870

13:00 - 14:00 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE (SERVICE TOP DRIVE, COMPOUND)

14:00 - 18:00 4.00| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 11,924 TO 11,965 (ROP 10.25 FT HR)

18:00 - 06:00 12.00( DRL 1 DRILL FROM 11,965 TO 12,076 (ROP 9.25 FT HR) SLOWWED TO 4-5 FTHR
FROM 11,975-12,003

4/28/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 12,076 TO 12,209 (ROP 19 FT HR) SHAKING LCM OUT DOWN TO

8-10% WOB 10-15, DHRPM 142, STARTED SEEPING WHEN WT UP TO 11.7+,

13:00 - 14:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, TOP DRIVE, (REPLACE QUIK RELEASE ON #1 MOTOR
CLUTCH)

14:00 - 18:30 4.50| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 12,209 TO 12,256 (ROP 10.4 FT HR) HIT BLACK HAWK SAND
TOOK KICK

18:30 - 02:30 8.00| CIRC 1 CIRCULATE THROUGH CHOKE WEIGHTING UP MUD SLOWLY 1-2 POINTS A

CIRCULATION NOT WANTING TO KNOCK THE BOTTOM OUT/ BRING UP LCM
TO 20%-25%

02:30 - 06:00 350|CIRC |2 STARTED LOSSING CIRCULATION WHEN MUD WEIGHT REACHED 12.3
PPG,SLOWWED PUMP DOWN AND PUMP HI LCM SWEEP,
4/29/2007 06:00 - 02:30 2050 CIRC |2 FIGHT LOST CIRCULATION, PIPES SHUTIN AND GAS SOMETIMES OVER 3000

UNIT'S, PUMPING LCM SWEEPS EVERY HALF HOUR AND BRINGING MUD
WEIGHT UP 1 POINT PER CIRCULATION WHILE GOING THROUGH CHOKE,

02:30 - 06:00 3.50| DRL 1 DRILL FROM 12,256 TO 12,285 (ROP 8.25 FT HR) BRING WT UP TO CONTROL
BACK GROUND GAS
4/30/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00| DRL DRILL FROM 12,285 TO 12,303 (ROP 9 FT HR.) 2-3 BBL LOSS 25-28% LCM,

SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE, COMPOUND, BLOCKS
DRILL FROM 12,303 TO 12,471' (ROP 8 FT. HR.) 2-3 BBLS LOSS
DRILL FROM 12,470 TO 12,480 (ROP 10' HR) MW 12.7/WOB 20-25/ DHRPM 130

08:00 - 09:00 1.00| RIG
09:00 - 06:00 21.00| DRL
5/1/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00{ DRL

RPN
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cst;jdbe Description of Operations
5/1/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00{DRL |1 SHAKE LCM OUT TO 10% LCM IN SYSTEM
08:00-21:00 | 13.00|RIG 2 REPAIR RIG/MASTER CLUTCH BOOT HAS HOLE IN IT, (NEW ONE COMING
FROM CASPER AND TWO MECHANICS)
21:00 - 06:00 9.00/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,490 TO 12,600 { ROP 12.2 HR ) MW 12.7/WOB 20-25/DHRPM
130
5/2/2007 06:00 - 08:30 250[DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12,600 TO 12,612 (ROP 4.8 FT HR)
08:30 - 10:30 2.00|CIRC |7 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP FOR SAMPLE/MUD LOGGER
10:30 - 17:00 6.50| RIG 2 SHORT TRIP OUT 50 STANDS SLOW BECAUSE OF AIR ISSUES WITH
: MASTER CLUTCH (WHEN THEY THROTTLE UP ON DRAWWORKS ABOUT
HALF THROTTLE IT KICK'S OUT THE MASTER CLUCH), (TIGHT SPOTS WERE
AT 12,225 TO 12,12,215 AND 11,960 TO 11,950 AND 11,925 TO 11,910) WORK
UP AND DOWN THROUGH TIGHT SPOTS/ WHILE TRIPPING ALSO WAS
TRYING TO WORK ON MASTER CLUTCH TO FIGURE OUT PROBLEM WITH IT,
17:00 - 21:00 400|TRP |14 TRIP IN HOLE 50 STANDS BREAKING CIRCULATION EVERY 22 JT.5/ WASHED
25' OF SOFT FILL(MOTOR IS REAL WEAK)
21:00 - 02:30 550|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE AND GET MUD PROPERIES INTO SHAPE(12.7+) BOTTOMS UP
FLARE 25'-307PIT GAIN 86 BBL.S/ WITH ECD.S FLARE IS 2-3'
02:30 - 03:30 1.00[CIRC |1 FLOW CHECK - OK - DROP SURVEY
03:30 - 06:00 250|TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN 7" LINER & STRAP OUT OF HOLE
5/3/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50| TRP |2 TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING LINER STRAPPING OUT OF HOLE(
SLM-12,604/ NO CORRECTION) (TRIPPING SLOW BECAUSE OF MASTER
CLUTCH TROUBLE ON RIG)
12:30 - 17:30 500/ TRP |1 RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK AND LAY DOWN BHA (WET)
17:30 - 18:00 0.50{ OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
18:00 - 19:30 150[csG |1 HELD SAFETY MEETING/RIG UP ROCKY MTN. CASING CREW
19:30 - 04:00 ss0lcse |2 RUN 7" CASING LINER,162 JT'S (84 JT'S 29# P110/78 JT'S 26# P110) BREAK
CIRCULATION EVERY 25 JT'S
04:00 - 05:00 100{csG |2 R/D CASING EQUIPMENT, FILL UP TOOL & LAY DOWN MACHINE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00/CSG |2 MAKE UP LINER HANGER ASSEMBLY
5/4/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50/CcsG |1 RIG DOWN CASING CREW
06:30 - 07:30 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOOTMS UP ON FIRST STAND OF DRILL PIPE
07:30 - 12:30 5.00|CSG {4 TRIP IN HOLE 59 STANDS/FILL EVERY TEN STANDS(BREAK CIRCULATION)
12:30 - 13:30 1.00/csG {1 WASH DOWN 3 STANDS
13:30 - 19:30 6.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE WHILE RECIPROCATING LINER/SHAKE OUT LCM IN PIT SYSTEM
LOST APOX 650 BBL
19:30 - 20:00 0.50|CSG |4 HANG LINER WITH SMITH HAND
20:00 - 00:30 450|CMT |2 HELD SAFETY MEETING AND CEMENT WITH HALLIBURTON (LOST RETURN'S
59 BBL INTO DISPLACEMENT )
PUMP CEMENT & DISPLACE CMT IN PLACE @ 0030 HRS BUMPED PLUB W/
500 PSI OVER CIRULATION
FLOAT HELD LEAD CEMENT TOTAL 1300 SACKS 4% GEL, 20% SSA-1, 3
LBS/SK SIL. 6% HALAD-344, 2% SUPER
TAIL CEMENT TOTAL 100 SACKS 2% GEL, 20% SSA-1, 3 LBS/SK SIL., .5%
HALAD-344,.2% HALAD-413,2%HR
12, .7% SUPER CBL, .2% SUSPEND-HT
00:30 - 01:00 0.50|CMT |1 LAY DOWN CEMENTING HEAD & HAL. CEMENT LINES
01:00 - 01:30 0.50| TRP |2 PULL 5 STANDS
01:30 - 03:00 150[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE 2X BOTTOMS UP
03:00 - 06:00 3.00|TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE W/ 7" LINER RUNNING TOOL & LAY DOWN RUNNING
TOOL ASSEMBLY
5/5/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00/CSG |4 TRIP OUT AND LAY DOWN 7" LINER HANGER
07:00 - 08:30 150|TRP |2 PICK UP PILOT AND POLISH MILL FOR TOP OF LINER AND TRIP iN HOLE TO
CLEAN TOP OF LINER
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code ngldbe Description of Operations
5/5/2007 08:30 - 09:30 1.00| OTH CUT AND SLIP DRILLING LINE
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
10:30 - 11:00 0.50| TRP |2 TRIP IN AND TAG TOP WITH POLISH MILL (NO ROTATION)
11:00 - 14:00 3.00| OTH STING INTO LINER TOP/ ROTATE TORQUING UP (MEASURED OUT TO BE

MILL IN IN LINER CATCH WOULD HANG UP IF PIPE WASN'T ROTATING,
MILLED AND WORK UP AND OWN THROUGH ROTATING, COULD WORK UP
AND DOWN THROUGH FULL STROKE OF CLEAN OUT TOOL WITH NO

PROBLEMS,

14:00 - 16:30 2.50| TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO SEE WHAT MILL LOOKS LIKE/HAD LITTLE WEAR/
LAYDOWN CLEAN OUT TOOL

16:30 - 21:30 5.00| TRP 2 TRIP IN (SLOW) WITH PACKER TO SET IN LINER HANGER

21:30 - 00:30 3.00| CSG 4 STING IN AND SET PACKER SEAL ASSEMBLY/ PRESSURE TEST SEALS 300
PSt AND POSITIVE TEST @ 1500 PSI FOR 30 MIN.

00:30 - 01:00 0.50|OTH PULL OUT TWO STANDS TO DO A NEGITIVE TEST ON LINER LAP

01:00 - 02:30 1.50| OTH FILL PILL TANK WITH WATER TRUCK AND DISPLACE MUD OUT OF HOLE

FOR NEGITIVE TEST ON LINER PACKER

02:30 - 03:30 1.00| PEQ 2 CARRY OUT NEGATIVE TEST ON 7' LINER & PACKER - OK -
03:30 - 05:00 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE OUT WATER & DISPLACE WELL TO 12.7 MUD.
05:00 - 06:00 1.00| RIG 2 WORK ON MASTER CLUTCH
5/6/2007 06:00 - 06:00 24.00| RIG 2 REPAIR MASTER CLUTCH ON COMPOUND AND AIR LINES- WHILE WORKING
ON MASTER CLUTCH CLEANED MUD TANKS & BUILD MUD VOLUME
5/7/2007 06:00 - 20:30 14.50| RIG 2 WORK ON MASTER CLUTCH (ROADS WERE CLOSED,COULDN'T BRING

CLUTCH OUT OF CASPER ROADS OPENED UP ARCUND 9:00 AM CLUTCH
SHOWED ON LOCATION @ 16:30YCHANGED OUT LINER'S IN PUMP TO 5"
20:30-01:30 5.00| TRP 3 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE IN MOUSE HOLE WHILE WAITING ON LAY DOWN
TRUCK (DO TO RIG REPAIR/DIDN'T KNOW WHEN THE RIG WAS GOING TO
RUN PROPERLY)

01:30 - 02:30 1.00| TRP RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK

02:30 - 03:00 0.50{ TRP LAY DOWN 5" DRILL PIPE USING L/D TRUCK TO 300

03:00 - 03:30 0.50| TRP REMOVE ROTATING HEAD

03:30 - 04.00 0.50| TRP CONTINUE TO LAY DOWN 5" DRILL PIPE USING LAY DOWN TRUCK
04:00 - 04:30 0.50| TRP RIG DOWN LAY DOWN EQUIPMENT

04:30 - 06.00 1.50| TRP TRIP IN HOLE TO LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE

TRIP IN HOLE 55 STANDS TO LAY DOWN
LAY DOWN 5" DRILL PIPE

5/8/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50| TRP
06:30 - 09:30 3.00| TRP
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| TRP TRIP IN HOLE 11 STANDS TO LAY DOWN

10:00 - 11:00 1.00{ TRP LAY DOWN 5" DRILL PIPE

11:00 - 12:00 1.00{ OTH CHANGE SAVER SUB AND GRABBER DIES (CHANGE TO 4" TOOLS)
12:00 - 19:00 7.00| BOP

WRNWNWWOUN W

2 TEST BOP TO 10,000 PSI AND 250 PSI LOWS (TOP AND BOTTOM PIPE RAMS,
BLIND RAMS, HCR, CHOKE MANIFOLD, TOP DRIVE VALVES, TIW, DART
VALVE) 7500 PS! AND 250 LOW (ANNULAR), CASING TEST 1500 PSI FOR 30
MiIN.
19:00 - 19:30 0.50| OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
19:30 - 21:00 1.50| TRP 2 RIG UP AND PICK UP BHA AND 4" DRILL-DRIFTING-

21:00 - 21:30 0.50| OTH INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER

21:30 - 01:00 3.50| TRP PICK UP 4" DRILL PIPE BREAK CIRCULATION ( EVERY 1000' )

01:00 - 02:00 1.00| TRP STRAP 140 JTS OF 4" DRILL PIPE ON PIPE RACK

02:00 - 06:00 4.00| TRP CONTINUE TO PICK UP 4" DRILL PIPE

5/9/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50| TRP PICK UP 4* DRILL PIPE-DRIFT SAME-CIRCULATE EVERY 30 JOINTS

08:30 - 09:30 1.00{ TRP RACK AND STRAP DRILL PIPE

09:30 - 13:30 4.00|RIG WENT TO AJUST BRAKES AND BRAKE BLOCK FELL OUT OF BAND (PULL
AND VISUAL INSPECT BANDS (PUT NEW BRAKE BLOCK'S ON-BURN IN THE
SAME)

NNNNMNN
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date: ~ 1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS:dbe Description of Operations
5/9/2007 13:30 - 17:00 350|TRP |2 PICK UP 4" DRILL PIPE -DRIFT
17:00 - 18:00 1.00{CSG |1 RIG DOWN LAY DOWN TRUCK
18:00 - 19:30 150(DRL |4 DRILL OUT LAND COLLAR @ 12520, FLOAT SHOE @ 12,563,SHOE @12,607
(CEMENT WAS SOFT EASY DRILLING/SURFACE SAMPLES ARE DRY BUT
PRETTY FLAKY)
19:30 - 20:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 12612 TO 12617
20:00 - 21:30 1.50|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP TO PERFORM FIT TEST
21:30 - 22:00 0.50|EQT |2 FORMATION INTEGRITY TEST 2000 PSI WITH 12.6 MUD WT=EQUIV. TO 15.64
MW
22:00 - 04:30 6.50| TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO RUN LOGS THROUGH CASING/ PULL ROTATING
HEAD
04:30 - 06:00 150[LOG |2 HELD SAFETY MEETING W/ SCH. LOGGING CREW - RIG UP LOGGING
EQUIPMENT & P/U LOGGING TOOLS
5/10/2007  |06:00-22:00 | 16.00|LOG |2 LOGGING IN CASED HOLE W/ SWS, SONIC SCAN - CBL-VDL-P/S TD - BSC.
LTD 12596'
22:00 - 23:00 1.00{LOG |2 RD LOGGERS
23:00 - 06:00 7.00{TRP (10 PU BI-CENTER BIT, MUD MOTOR, & TIH, RAN BHA & 1 ROW OF DP, FiLL PIPE
& BREAK CIRC, THEN EA. 3 ROWS, TAKING AN HOUR TO FILL PIPE, #1 PUMP
NOT PUMPING, & DRILLER FORGOT TO OPEN MUD VALVE & BLEW A NAIL
LAST FILL.
5/11/2007  |06:00 - 07:30 150/ TRP |10 TIH, FILL PIPE EA 2 ROWS, INSTALL ROTATING HEAD
07:30 - 09:30 2.00|RIG TAG BOTTOM, WORK ON PUMPS, PRESSURED UP.
09:30 - 10:30 1.00{CIRC |1 C&C, MIX & PUMP PILL
10:30 - 17:00 6.50|TRP  [10 TOH F/ EXCESS PRESSURE. 4 NOZZLES PLUGGED DRY FIRST 20 STANDS,
THEN CAME WET THE REST OF THE WAY OUT.
17:00 - 18:30 150| TRP |10 PU & MU NEW BIT, LOST SLIP SEGMENT DOWN HOLE.
18:30 - 20:30 200|woT |4 LD MUD MOTOR & BIT, WO JUNK BASKET
20:30 - 01:30 5.00|TRP |2 PU MILL TOOTH BIT, JUNK SUB, BIT SUB, & TIH RAN BHA & 1 ROW DP FILL
PIPE, THEN FILL PIPE EA. 4 ROWS
01:30 - 02:30 1.00{ OTH CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB
02:30 - 06:00 350{TRP |2 TIH, FILL PIPE EA. 4 ROWS.
5/12/2007  |06:00 - 06:30 0.50|TRP |3 TIH W/ JUNK SUB
06:30 - 07:00 0.50{ REAM (1 W&R 50' TO BOTTOM, 5'FILL
07:00 - 09:30 250{DRL |1 WORK JUNK BASKET, NO EXCESS TORQUE AT ANY TIME WHILE WORKING
OR WHILE DRILLING 17 OF NEW HOLE IT WAS AS IF SEGMENT WAS NOT
THERE. ONE HAND SWEARS HE SAW IT HIT THE MUD IN THE ANNULAS SO
DON'T KNOW WHAT TO MAKE OF IT.
09:30 - 11:30 2.00|CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP & PUMP PILL F/ TOH
11:30 - 12:00 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE CHAIN ON PIPE SPINNERS, DIDN'T HAVE A NEW ONE ON
LOCATION, HAD TO WAIT FOR IT TO BE DELIVERED BEFORE WE COULD
REPLACE IT, USING SPINNERS TO BACK OUT DP JUST IN CASE.
12:00 - 15:00 3.00|TRP |2 TOH W/ JUNK BASKET
15:00 - 15:30 0.50]| RIG 2 REPAIR CHAIN ON SPINNER
15:30 - 17:00 1.50| TRP |2 TOH W/ JUNK BASKET & FILL TRIP TANK
17:00 - 17:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPLACE CHAIN ON SPINNERS
17:30 - 20:30 3.00 FINISH TOH W/ BASKET, EMPTY CONTENTS, FOUND 5 PC OF STEEL, 1 PC OF
TONG DIE ABOUT 1 1/2" LONG W/ A LARGE SCRAP THAT WOULD MATCH UP
W/ CUTTERS ON BI-CENTER, & 4 SMALLER PCS. BIT HAD NO JUNK MARKS
ON IT AT ALL. ALSO BROUGHT OUT 23 PCS OF ALUMIINUM THE LARGEST IS
ABOUT 1 1/4" x 3/4" X 1/4"
20:30 - 22:30 2.00| RIG 2 REPLACE TABLE LOCK ON BREAK OUT SIDE.
22:30 - 06:00 7.50{TRP |2 PU BI-CENTER BIT, MUD MOTOR, XO & TIH, RAN BHA & 1 ROW, FILL PIPE &
CIRC THEN RUN 4 ROWS AT A TIME, FILL PIPE & CIRC.
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code CS(;J(;)e Description of Operations
5(13/2007  |06:00 - 13:30 7.50|DRL |1 DRILL 12634 - 12797, 163, 21.73 FPH, WBO 10-11K, RPM 60 ON SURFACE, &
59 DOWN HOLE. 227 GPM.
13:30 - 14:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
14:30-06:00 | 1550{DRL |1 DRILL 12797 - 13155, 356", 22.96 FPH, WOB 8-12, RPM 120, 60 ON SURFACE &
60 DOWN HOLE. 230 GPM. LOWER WT SEEMS TO DRILL SLOWER, HOPE TO
BE @ CORE POINT AROUND 18:00 THIS EVENING.
5/14/12007  |06:00 - 13:30 750/DRL |1 DRILL 13155' - 128", 17.06 FPH, WOB 8-12, RPM 120, 60 ON SURFACE, 60
DOWN HOLE, 230 GPM.
13:30 - 14:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
14:30 - 20:00 5.50/DRL |1 DRILL 13283' - 13275, 92", 16.72 FPH, WOB 8-14, RPM 120, 60 ON SURFACE, 60
DOWN HOLE. 230 GPM.
20:00 - 00:30 450/CIRC |1 C&C F/ CORE, MIX PILL.
00:30 - 01:00 0.50|SUR |1 DROP SURVEY @ 13313', CHECK FLOW, FLOWING 1/2* STREAM FOR 30 MIN.
01:00 - 05:00 400/CIRC |1 BRING PREMIX TO 13.6 PPG, & SPOT 250 BBL OF 13.6 PPG MUD ON BOTTOM
F/ TOH BOTTOMS UP FLARE 8', 3000U+ BUG SPIKE AT BOTTOMS UP.
5/15/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 400|TRP |2 TOH F/ CORE #1 CAME WET @ STAND # 80 OUT.
10:00 - 11:30 1.50| CIRC |1 C&C, MIX #2 PILL
11:30 - 13:30 200|TRP |2 FINISH TOH F/ CORE #1, STILL WET AT TIMES. RETRIEVE MULTISHOT
SURVEY TOOL, SURVEY @ 13313 2.3 DEG, 112.6 AZ.
13:30 - 15:30 200{TRP |2 LD MOTOR & BIT, PU CORE BBL & BIT, FUNCTION BOTH PIPES, & BLIND
RAMS
15:30 - 16:30 1.00|TRP |2 TIH W/ BHA & 2 STANDS OF DP, FILL PIPE & CIRC 2 MIN.
16:30 - 18:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP & CUT 162’ OF DRLG. LINE
18:00 - 19:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE.
19:00 - 22:30 350|TRP |2 TIH W/ 4 ROWS DP, FILL PIPE & CIRC. REPEAT EA. 4 ROWS TO 8612, CIRC 1
MIN., 9682, CIRC 2 MIN, TIH TO 11828' FILL PIPE & CIRC EA. 4 ROWS.
22:30 - 01:30 3.00[CIRC |1 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD @ 11828' & CIRC BOTTOMS UP. 1" FLARE. 2375u
GAS
01:30 - 03:00 150|TRP |2 TIH, FILL PIPE @ 12602', TIH TO 13375'
03:00 - 06:00 3.00|CIRC |1 FILL PIPE & CIRC BOTTOMS UP, 8 FLARE 1 1/2 HR INTO CIRC. DROP BALL
TO START CORING.
5/16/2007  |06:00-17:00 | 11.00{DRL |1 CUT CORE #1, 13375’ - 13435, 60', 5.45 FPH, WOB 4-10K RPM 65, 180 GPM.
17:00 - 21:00 400/CIRC |1 BREAK OFF CORE, C&C F/ TOH W/ CORE #1 BOTTOMS UP GAS 4012u
21:00 - 22:00 1.00|CIRC |1 SPOT 230 BBL OF 13.6 PPG MUD ON BOTTOM.
22:00 - 06:00 8.00|TRP |2 TOH W/ CORE #1
5/17/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 100|{GEO |2 LD CORE #1, 100% RECOVERY, 60'
07:00 - 08:00 1.00|GEO |2 CHANGE BITS & SPACE OUT.
08:00 - 13:00 500|{TRP |2 TIH F/ CORE #2, FILL PIPE & CIRC @ BHA & 1 ROW DP, THEN EA 4 ROWS TO
76 STANDS & CIRC 5 MIN. RIH TO 11832
13:00 - 13:30 050|TRP |2 PULL STRIPPING RUBBER OUT OF BERRING ASSM, & INSTALL ROTATING
HEAD RUBBER.
13:30 - 14:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRC. 30 MIN.
14:00 - 15:00 100|TRP |2 TIH W/ LAST 18 STANDS PU 2 JTS OF DP..
15:00 - 17:00 2.00|CIRC {1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP. BUG = 2548u 2' FLARE.
17:00-06:00 | 13.00{GEO |2 TAG BOTTOM, & START CORE #2 @ 13435' - 13487", 52', 4.0 FPH, WOB 4-10,
RPM 65, 180 GPM. HOPE TO BE @ 13495' BY 08:00.
5/18/2007  |06:00 - 08:30 250|GEO |2 CORE, 13487 - 13495, 8, 4.0 FPH, WOB 9-10K, RPM 85, 180 GPM.
08:30 - 10:30 2.00[CIRC |1 BREAK CORE, CIRC BOTTOMS UP, MUD LOGGERS EQUIPMENT QUIT
WORKING, NO ACCURATE GAS READING
10:30 - 18:00 7.50| TRP |2 CHECK F/ FLOW, PUMP PILL, TOH W/ CORE #2. LOST 14 BBL OF MUD ON
TOH.
18:00 - 19:00 1.00{GEO |2 LD CORE #2, 100% RECOVERY, 60+
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code ng’dbe Description of Operations
§/18/2007 | 19:00 - 01:30 6.50| TRP (10 PU BIT, MUD MOTOR, XO, & TIH TO 5500', BREAK CIRC. THEN EA. 4 ROWS TO
12603'
01:30 - 02:00 0.50| RIG 8 REMOVE GRABBER BOX F/ TOP DRIVE.
02:00 - 04:00 2.00[CIRC |1 CIRC. BOTTOMS UP
04:00 - 06:00 2.00| RIG 2 REPLACE TORQUE CONVERTER SEAL ON #2 FLOOR MOTOR
5§/19/2007 | 06:00 - 09:00 3.00{RIG 2 REPAIR RIG, FINISH REPALCING SEAL IN TORQUE CONVERTER ON #2
FLOOR MOTOR
09:00 - 10:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
10:00 - 10:30 0.50| TRP |10 FINISH TIH PU 2 JTS DP.
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| REAM |1 WSREAM 120' TO BOTTON, DRILL UP CORE STUMP
11:30-06:00 { 18.50|DRL |1 DRILL 13495' - 13835', 340", 18.37 FPH, WOB 8-14K, RPM 120, 60 ON
SURFACE, 60 DOWN HOLE. 230 GPM BOP DRILL BOTH CREWS. 13715' -
13720' TOOK 2 HOURS TO DRILL,
5/20/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 5.00|DRL |1 DRILLING 13835' - 13931', 96", 19.2 FPH, WOB 10-11K, RPM 120, 60 ON
SURFACE, 60 DOWN HOLE 230 GPM
11:00 - 12:00 1.00|RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE
12:00 - 17:00 5.00{DRL |1 DRILL 13931’ - 14043, 112, 22.2 FPH, WOB 10-11K, RPM 120, 60 ON SURFACE,
; 60 DOWN HOLE, 230 GPM
'17:00 - 18:30 1.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, BOTH PUMPS DOWN, NOTHING REALY STOOD OUT AS THE
! PROBLEM, BUT | THINK WE MAY HAVE A CHARGE PUMP PROBLEM.
-18:30 - 00:00 550[DRL |1 DRILL 14034’ - 14116', 73, 13.27 FPH, WOB 10-14k, RPM 45-65 ON SURFACE,
60 DOWN HOLE, 230 GPM GAS TO SURFACE
00:00 - 06:00 6.00{WCL |1 8108u GAS TO SURFACE VENTING THROUGH BUSTER, CIRC OUT GAS ON
BUSTER, 12-25' FLARE. PUMP PRESSURE STARTED FALLING OFF @ 14101',
NOT MUCH INCREASE IN FLOW UNTIL JUST BEFORE GAS HIT SURFACE.
LOOSING 8.5 BPH MUD, CIRC W/ 15-25' FLARE, BGG 300 - 400u THROUGH
BUSTER.
5/21/2007 | 06:00 - 14:30 8.50|weL |1 CIRC OUT GAS ON CHOKE, RAISED WT F/ 13.3 - 13.5, SHUT IN WELL CHECK
F/ PRESSURE, NONE. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP 3 TIMES, THEN CHECKED
F/ FLOW, NONE, STARTED TO CIRCULATE, FLOW F/ 0 - 50%, VERY SPRATIC.
FLOW STEADY WHILE ON CHOKE, GAINING VOLUME WHILE CIRCULATING,
RUNNING 7 BPH OF MU WATER.
14:30-03:00 | 12.50|DRL |1 DRILL 14116’ - 14330', 214, 17.12 FPH, WOB 2-8, RPM 120, 60 ON SURFACE, 60
DOWN HOLE, FLOW HAS BEEN ERATIC SINCE WE HAVE BEEN BACK TO
DRILLING, THIS TIME IT LOOKS AS THOUGH WE TOOK ABOUT A 50 BBL
GAIN. WHEN GAS HIT SURFACE IT BLEW THE FLOW SENSOR OUT OF THE
FLOW LINE.
03:00 - 06:00 3.00|wcL |1 SHUT IN WELL, FCP AT 1100 PSI AND CLIMBING WITH CHOKE 1/2 OPEN, 3"
CHOKE LINE LEAKING, SI WELL TO FIX & SICP HIT 1750 IN 3 MIN. OPENED
' CHOKE BACK UP FCP @ 1600 W/ CHOKE 1/4 OPEN. HAVE NOT TRIED TO
GET A SIDPP AS SHOE IS ONLY GOOD TO 2650 PSI WILL TRY TO GET MUD
ON BACK SIDE, APPEARS TO BE LOOSING FLUID AS DPP WILL CLIMB TO
1100 PSI & FALL OFF TO 1070 PSi, FCP WILL FALL TO 1600 THEN CLIMB TO
1700-1800.
5/22/2007  |06:00-20:00 | 14.00/WCL |1 CIRC OUT GAS ON CHOKE, RAUSED MW F/ 13.6 PPG TO 14.0 PPG, MADE 3
COMPLETE CIRCULATIONS, SICP 0. SIDPP 0. OPNED ANNULAR, NO FLOW.
20:00 - 20:30 050|wcL |1 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD BERRING ASSM. WELL SWABBING WHEN
WE PULLED STAND TO CHANGE UT HEAD.
20:30 - 22:00 1.50[weL |1 STARTED TO CIRC THROUGH BUSTER, GAINED 52 BBL
{22:00 - 06:00 8.00jwCL |1 SIW & GIRC OUT GAS ON CHOKE, RAISING MW TO 14.2 PPG. ON CIRC #2 AT
PRESENT, CHOKE FULL OPEN, MW IN 14.2, MW OUT 13.9 GAS CUT, GAINING
FLUID SINCE 01:45, PARTIAL MU WATER, PARTIAL BARITE ADDITIONS, BUT
STILL SEEM TO BE IN EXCESS OF THAT. WiLL SEE BOTTOMS UP AROUND
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code g:dbe Description of Operations
5/22/2007  |22:00 - 06:00 goojwcL |1 06:00
5/23/2007  |06:00-06:00 | 24.00(WCL |1 CIRC OUT GAS ON CHOKE, MADE 3 CIRCULATIONS, CHECK F/ FLOW, WELL
STATIC F/ 3 MIN, THEN FLOWING 27 BPH, SURGING, LET WELL FLOW 30 MIN,
GAINED 6 BBL ACCORDING TO PVTS. Si & MONITOR PRESSURES, SICP
STABILIZED @ 340,SICP SLOW STROKE PUMP, FLOAT OPENED @ 275
SIDPP. CIRC & RAISED WT TO 14.7 PPG, FIRST ROUND, THEN TO 15.0 ON
SECOND ROUND. CIRC ROUNG #3 BEFORE CHECKING F/ FLOW, MW IN
15.0,MW OUT 14.6 AT REPORT TIME.
§/24/2007 | 06:00 - 07:00 100|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE THROUGH CHOKE
07:00 - 07:30 0.50| OTH OPEN ANNULAR AND CHECK FOR FLOW (NO FLOW)
07:30 - 09:30 2.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP TO SEE GAS/ FLARE SIZE (6'-8')/5400 GAS UNITS
PEAK
09:30 - 16:30 7.00{DRL {1 RESUME DRILLING FROM 14,330 TO 14,450 (ROP 17' HR) WOB 10K, 44 ROT,
92 STROKES,
16:30 - 17:30 1.00|RIG 1 RIG SERVICE /GREASE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
17:30 - 02:30 9.00{DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 14,450 TO 14,644 (ROP 21.5' HR.)
02:30 - 03:30 1.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS HAD 11 BBL GAIN AND GAIN IN GAS UNITS,
03:30 - 06:00 250[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 14,644 TO 14,690 (ROP 18.4' HR.)
5/25/2007  |06:00 - 10:30 450|DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 14,690 TO 14,775 (ROP 18.9' HR) WOB 8-10/ ROT. RPM 44/
SPM 92
10:30 - 11:00 050[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS- LOST TOTAL RETURNS FOR 5-7 MIN (DRY GAS 15-20'
FLARE) REGAIN RETURN WITH NO LOSSES
11:00 - 19:30 8.50|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 14,775 TO 14,890 (ROP 13.5' HR) TRY DIFFERNT PERAMITORS
TO GET TO DRILL-NO LUCK FRILLING A STEADY 7-9' HR
19:30 - 21:30 2.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP & BUILD PILL FILL TRIP TANK
21:30 - 22:00 0.50|SUR |1 DROP SURVEY
22:00 - 22:30 0.50|CIRC |1 PUMP 1# OVER PILL AND SPOT
22:30 - 23:30 1.00| TRP |10 TRIP OUT FOR BIT #23 AND MUD MOTOR TO 13046, (HOLE NOT TAKING
PROPER FILL STOPPED AND CHECK FOR FLOW-SLIGHT FLOW
23:30 - 03:30 4.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP TWICE WHILE BUILDING #2 SLUG/GAS 1S
FEEDING IN FROM BOTTOM SO DISCUSSED WITH STEVE AND DECIDED TO
TRIP TO BOTTOM AND BRING WT UP
03:30 - 05:00 150/ TRP |2 TRIP IN 19 STANDS
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE THROUGH HALF CHOKE HOLDING STAND PIPE PSI @
1200-CASING 900/ (PUMP WENT DOWN WENT TO SWITCH PUMP AND GAIN
30 BBLS, SHUT IN WELL 1900 PSI ON CSING
5/26/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 5.00[CIRC |1 CIRCULATING THROUGH CHOKE-OFF CHOKE @ 6:45-BOTTOMS UP 30-35'
FLARE/30 BBL GAIN, BRING MUD WT UP TO 15.5 ALL THE WAY AROUND,
BUILD 2# SLUG TO SPOT
11:00 - 12:00 1.00[CIRC |1 SPOT #2 OVER PILL ALL IN OPEN HOLE AND INTO CASING 20 FEET
12:00 - 13:00 1.00| TRP |10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE 10 STANDS (SLOW) (NOT TAKING PROPER AMOUNT OF
FLUID (NONE GOING BACK INTO PIT IN OVER FILL TUBE)
13:00 - 13:30 0.50| OTH STOPPED GHECK FOR FLOW WELL STILL FLOWING BUT WASN'T GAINING IN
MUD TANKS, CHECKED EQUIPMENT-CHARGE PUMP WAS ON HAND IN PUMP
HOUSE, CHECK FLOW GAIN (NO FLOW)
13:30 - 14:30 1.00|TRP |12 TRIP TO SHOE (WET)-SLOW
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 PUMP DRY SLUG AND FILL TRIP TANK CHECK FLOW (NO FLOW)
15:00 - 20:00 5.00|TRP |12 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
20:00 - 21:00 1.00| OTH HANDLE BHA AND CHANGE MUD MOTOR AND Bl CENTER BIT/ SURVEY 1.2
@14,836 (FUNCTION TEST BOPE EQUIP MENT)
21:00 - 04:00 7.00{TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE BREAK CIRCULATION AT BHA AND EVERY 33
STANDS DEPTHS- 1292, 4116, 7417, 10,622 (RAN 3 FT FLARE ON TRIP IN /
WELL WAS NOT FLOWING ON FLOW CHECKS)
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location:  4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dbe Description of Operations
5/26/2007  |04:00 - 04:30 0.50|CIRC |1 BREAK CIRCULATION @ SHOE
04:30 - 06:00 1.50| RIG 6 SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE @ SHOE (18 WRAPS)
5/27/2007  |06:00 - 07:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE FUNCTION ANNULAR
07:00 - 07:30 050|TRP |2 TRIP IN TWELVE STANDS-SLOW
07:30 - 08:00 050[CIRC |1 BREAK CIRCULATION, CIRCULATE 1/2 OF 2# SLUG INTO CASING TO BLEND
08:00 - 08:30 050[TRP |2 TRIP IN 11 STANDS SLOW
08:30 - 10:30 200[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP/ WASH TO BOTTOM STAGE PUMP UP TO BREAK
CIRCULATION, PEAK GAS 1600 UNITS NO GAIN IN MUD OR FLOW
10:30-06:00 | 19.50/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 14890 TO 15180 (ROP 14.8' HR)
5/28/2007  |06:00 - 13:30 750[DRL |1 DRILL FROM 15,180 TO 15,291-(ROP 14.8' HR)-GAS FROM DEPTH OF 15206,
HAD FLOW INCREASE AND AN 18 BBL GAIN IN PITS
13:30 - 14:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
14:30-06:00 | 1550|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 15, 291 TO 15,490 (ROP 12.8' HR)
5/29/2007  |06:00 - 14:00 8.00|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 15,490 TO 15,583 (ROP 11.6' HR)
14:00 - 15:00 1.00| RIG 1 RIG SERVICE- GREASE BLOCKS, SWIVEL AND COMPOUND, TOPDRIVE
15:00 - 19:30 450|DRL  [1 DRILL FROM 15,583 TO 15654 (ROP 15.7) HAVING TO KEEP WOB 15, CLAY
LIKE SILT STONE COMING OVER SHAKERS
19:30 - 22:30 3.00|CIRC |1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP 2 TIMES TO CLEAN OUT GAS IN WELL BORE, GAS
WAS FROM DEPTH OF 15,623 CALCULATED, GAINED 30 BBL AND FLARE
15-20' HIGH, GAS UNITS BEST-6100 UNITS SURGED WHEN GAS HIT
SHAKERS BROUGHT MUD WT TO 15.5
22:30 - 06:00 750{DRL |1 DRILL FROM 15,654 TO 15,720 (ROP 8.8' HR.)
5/30/2007  |06:00 - 09:30 3.50|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 15,720 TO 15,777 (ROP 16.2' HR)
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
10:30 - 11:30 100/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 15,777 TO 15,805 (ROP 28' HR)
11:30 - 12:30 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE OUT GAS THROUGH CHOKE PIT GAIN OF 40 BBL.S/ 100 PSI ON
CASING PRESSURE ON FULL OPEN CHOKE
12:30 - 13:00 0.50|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 15,805 TO 15,841 (ROP 72' HR)
13:00 - 13:30 050/CIRC |1 CIRCULATE THRU CHOKE ON SECOND BOTTOMS UP-IT HAD A GOOD PUSH
TO IT/PICKED UP AND PUT ON THE CHOKE GAINED 28 BBL.S
13:30-06:00 | 16.50{DRL |1 DRILL FROM 15,841 TO 16,022 (ROP 10.9' HR) (BROUGHT MW TO 15.6 TO
CONTROL CONNECTION GAS SEEMS TO BE HOLDING CONNECTION GAS
BACK)
5/31/2007  |06:00 - 10:00 400|/DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 16,022 TO 16,069 (ROP 11.75' HR)
10:00 - 11:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
11:00-06:00 | 19.00|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 16,069 TO 16,295 (ROP 11.89' HR) @ 16,209 SLOWED DOWN TO
9 FOOT A HOUR, CHANGE BIT PERAMETERS NO CHANGE/ CHECKED WITH
MUD LOGGER CHANGED FROM 80% SHALE, 10% SILTSTONE, 10%
SANDSTONE CHANGED TO 50% SHALE, 50% SILTSTONE STARTED PICKING
UP @ 16,269
6/1/2007 06:00 - 11:30 550/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 16, 295 TO 16,360 (ROP 11.8’ HR) WOB 15, DHRPM 110, MW 15.5
11:30 - 12:30 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
12:30 - 18:00 5.50|DRL |1 DRILL FROM 16,360 TO 16,452
18:00-06:00 | 12.00| RIG 2 WORK ON SWAB, LINER, DIS-CHARGE MODULE ON #2 MUD PUMP OFF BULL
WHEEL SIDE/ #1 MUD PUMP CROSS HEAD OUT PUMP IS UNOPERATABLE,
CHANGE OUT SWIVEL PACKING ALSO ( CAN'T CIRCULATE, WORK PIPE UP
AND DOWN)WELL STARTED FLOWING 1 BBL HR SHUT IN WELL AT 00:00, @
2:30 WELL HAD ZERO CASING PRESSURE OPEN WELL AND RE CHECK
FLOW AND WORK PIPE (WELL FLOWING 3/4 BBL AN HOUR) RE SHUT IN
WELL
6/2/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50|RIG 2 WORK ON #2 PUMP MODULE,COULDN'T GET HEX-BOLT'S OUT OF MODULE,
MONITORING WELL (#1 PUMP HAS X-HEAD OUT)# PUMP WAS READY @
11:30
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location: 4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code ng’dbe Description of Operations
6/2/2007 10:30 - 15:00 450[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE GAS-BOTTOMS UP TWICE WITH HALLIBURTON (5 BBL MIN)
FIRST HAD A GOOD PUSH HAD TO SHUT IN AND HOLD 3/4 CHOKE WITH 300
PSI ON CHOKE HAD 32 BBL GAIN, GAS UNITS ALL OVER DUE TO LEVEL OF
MUD AT SHAKERS 35' FLARE AT PEAK
15:00 - 16:30 1.50{CIRC |1 SPOT 190 BBL PILL 17.4 OVER FALLOWED BY 130 BBL 15.5 MUD
16:30 - 01:00 850|TRP |2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE SLOW TO SHOE-TIGHT SPOT'S AT 15,510, 15,164 PULLED
UP WORKED DOWN AND PULLED THROUGH WITH REG. DRAG (LOOKS
GOOD) FLOW CHECKED AT SHOE (NO FLOW)
01:00 - 02:30 1.50|TRP |1 HANDLE BHA LAY DOWN MUD MOTOR AND PICK UP HIGH SPEED MUD
MOTOR AND SURFACE TEST 200 GPM 500 PS}, PICK AND LAY DOWN JARS
02:30 - 06:00 350 TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE FILL PIPE AT BHA, AND EVERY 3 ROWS
6/3/2007 06:00 - 09:30 350[TRP |2 TRIP IN HOLE WITH IMPREG AND HIGH SPEED MUD MOTOR, FILL EVERY 33
STANDS TO SHOE FILLS BHA, 4463, 7816, 10,675, 12,738
09:30 - 10:30 1.00| OTH INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER (PULL STRIPPING RUBBER OUT OF ROTATING
HEAD)
10:30 - 11:30 1.00| OTH FIX OIL LEAKS ON TOP DRIVE, CHANGE SAVER SUB, GRABBER DIES
11:30 - 12:00 0.50|TRP |2 TRIP IN 20 STANDS IN OPEN HOLE (SLOW)
12:00 - 12:30 0.50|CIRC |1 BREAK CIRCULATEION, CIRCULATE HEAVY PILL INTO CASING (BLEND)
12:30 - 13:00 0.50{TRP |2 TRIP AND SCREW INTO LAST STAND TO CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
13:00 - 14:00 1.00{CIRC |1 CIRCULATE 2# OVER SLUG OUT OF HOLE WHILE WASHING TO BOTTOM
14:00 - 14:30 0.50| OTH CHANGE OUT GASKET ON ROTATING HEAD (LEAKING MUD IN SUB AND
; FILLED CELLUR
114:30 - 16:00 1.50[CIRC |1 CIRCULATE 2# OVER SLUG OUT OF HOLE HAD 23 BBL GAIN,10°' FLARE, 7002
UNITS OF PEAK GAS
16:00 - 20:00 400[DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 16,452 TO 16,472 (ROP &' HR)
20:00 - 20:30 0.50| RIG 2 RIG REPAIR SHUT DOWN DRILLING TO PULL OFF PUMP SHED TOP AND
PUMP OUT WITH CRANE
20:30 - 06:00 9.50/DRL |1 DRILLING FROM 16, 472 TO 16,522 (ROP 5.25' HR) WOB 12/ ROT 85/ GPM 242/
DHRPM 522
6/4/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00{DRL |1 DRILL FROM 16,522 TO 16,559 (ROP 5.2' HR) WOB 12, ROT 66, DHRPM 527
(DAKOTA SILT CAME IN @ 16,516)
13:00 - 14:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE (GREASE COMPOUND, DRAW-WORKS, TOP
DRIVE, SWIVEL PACKING)
14:00-06:00 | 16.00/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 16,559 TO 16,661 (ROP 6.3' HR) WOB 14, ROT 65, DHRPM 527
6/5/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 16,661 TO 16,721 (ROP 9.2' HR) TALK TO BLM FOR EXTENSION
FOR BOPE TEST TALKED TO RAY ARNOLD AND IT WAS OKED BY MATT
BAKER
12:30 - 13:30 1.00|RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, GREASE TOP DRIVE, COMPOUND, DRAW-TOOL
13:30-06:00 | 16.50/DRL |1 DRILL FROM 16,721 TO 16,878 (ROP 9.5' HR)
6/6/2007 06:00 - 10:00 400|DRL |1 DRILL 16,878 TO 16,916 (ROP 9.5' HR) WOB 13, RPM 62, DHRPM 497
10:00 - 11:00 1.00| RIG 1 SERVICE TOP DRIVE, COMPOUND, SWIVEL, DRAWTOOL
11:00-03:30 | 1650/DRL |1 DRILL 16,916 TO 17,045 (ROP 7.8' HR) WOB 15, RPM 65, DHRPM 500
03:30 - 04:00 0.50| OTH WORK TIGHT HOLE ON CONNECTION, WORK UP THROUGH (WANTED TO
PACK OFF), WORK BACK TO BOTTOM 1' OF TIGHT SPOT
04:00 - 06:00 200{DRL |1 DRILL 17,045 TO 17,060 (ROP 7.5' HR) WOB 15, RPM 65, DHRPM 500
6/7/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00[DRL |1 DRILL 17060’ - 17110', 50, 6.25 FPH, WOB 14K, RPM 65 ON SURFACE & 500
: DOWN HOLE
14:00 - 15:30 1.50| RIG 1 SREVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE, WORK TIGHT CONNECTION FOR AN HOUR OF
THIS
15:30 - 16:00 0.50{DRL |1 DRILL 17110' - 17114', 4 CALLED TD FOR THIGH CONNECTIONS, RAISING MW
TO 15.5 PPG
16:00 - 21:00 5.00{CIRC |1 CIRC & COND F/ SHORT TRIP, RAISING MW TO 15.5 PPG.
21:00 - 22:30 1.50| TRP |14 STARTED SHORT TRIP, FIRST 5 STANDS TIGHT, PUMPED OUT #2 & 3
|
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Csé'ge Description of Operations
6/7/2007 22:30 - 23:00 0.50[|CIRC |1 PUMPED 30 BBL PILL, CAME WET, PULLED 3 MORE STANDS, PUMP MORE
PILL
23:00 - 01:30 250/ TRP {14 FINISHED SHORT TRIP WET, WASHED LAST 90' TO BOTTOM. NO FILL
01:30 - 06:00 450/CIRC |1 C&C, GAINED 52 BBL, SHUT WELL IN & CIRC THORUGH CHOKE, OPENED
WELL BACK UP, INCREASED STROKES, PRESSURE CAME UP, PIPE MOVES
FREE, WHEN YOU SHUT DOWN THE PUMP THE PRESSURE DROPS RIGHT
OFF. 05:45, MOVED PIPE DOWN & SET 3K ON BIT, PRESSURE DROPPED
OFF, AS OF NOW PRESSURES ARE ABOUT RIGHT.
6/8/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00|CIRC |1 C&C, CIRCULATE OUT GAS, MAINTAIN 15.5 PPG MW. MUD MOTOR
PRESSURING UP. SET WT ON BIT AND PRESSURE WOULD FALL OFF FOR A
WHILE.
10:00 - 12:30 250|TRP |2 TOH 7 STANDS, PUMPED QUT #2 & 3, ROTATED THE REST OUT WITH OUT
PUMP.
12:30 - 13:30 1.00[CIRC |1 C&C, MOTOR LOCKED UP, BLEW A NAIL
13:30 - 14:00 0.50|RIG 2 REPLACE NAIL IN POP OFF.
14:00 - 17:30 350|CIRC |1 CIRC W/ HALIBURTON, BLEW THE PACKING OUT OF DRIVER SIDE PUMP,
CIRC W/ 1 PUMP, BLEW PACKING OUT OF IT ALSO.
17:30 - 23:00 550|CIRC |1 CIRC W/ RIG PUMP @ 53 SPM @ 3 BPM @ 2800 PSI. SPOTTED 250 BBLOF
17.5 PPG MUD @ 16462', & DISPLACED W/ 175 BBL OF 15.5 PPG MUD
23:00 - 06:00 7.00|TRP |2 TOH F/ LOGS W/ SLM, WET & SLOW HOPE TO BE RIGGING UP LOGGERS BY
NOON
6/9/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00|TRP |2 TOH F/ LOGS W/ SLM SLOW & WET ALL THE WAY
11:00 - 12:00 1.00|RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, WORK ON TRIP TANK MOTOR
12:00 - 14:00 200|TRP |2 TOH F/ LOGS W/ SLM SLOW & WET ALL THE WAY
14:00 - 16:00 2.00| RIG 2 WORK ON ROTARY BUSHINGS SO WE COULD REMOVE THE ROTATING
HEAD, EDGES ROLLED IN FROM BEATING ON TABLE WHEN SLIPS WOULD
STICK, HANDS NOT DOPING BUSHINGS OR SLIPS.
16:00 - 19:00 3.00{TRP |2 FINISH TOH F/ LOGS W/ SLM, HAD PROBLEMS WITH CROWN -O- MATIC. SLM
= 13.65' LONG. NO CORRECTIONS.
19:00 - 22:30 3.50| OTH CLEAN FLOOR & INSTALL LOGGING ADPTER
22:30 - 23:30 1.00| OTH SCHLUMBERGER, TOOK, TIME TO SET UP SATALITE, & COMPUTERS
BEFORE STARTING IN THE HOLE FOR FEAR OF BHT & WO SHEVE
23:30 - 05:00 550/LOG |1 RIH W/ TRIPPLE COMBO W, BHC SONIC, TAG UP @ 13450', FIRST READING
@ 13556, & LOG OUT TO SHOE @ 12605'
05:00 - 06:00 1.00{LOG |1 RD SCHLUMBERGER
6/10/2007  {06:00 - 07:30 1.50| OTH RD SWS, LD LOGGING ADPTOR & MUD MOTOR. PU BIT, & BIT SUB.
07:30 - 12:00 450(TRP |2 TIH W/ BHA, FILL PIPE & CIRC @ 1268".
12:00 - 12:30 0.50| RIG 2 REPAIR HYDROMATIC
12:30 - 18:00 550|TRP |2 TIH, FILL PIPE & CIRC @ 5548', 9723, TIH TO 12740
18:00 - 19:00 1.00| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD
19:00 - 20:00 1.00|RIG 6 SLIP & CUT 19 WRAPS OF DRILLING \LINE WHILE CIRC & COND.
20:00 - 21:00 1.00|CIRC |1 SERVICE RIG, CIRC BU. 2-3' FLARE.
21:00 - 00:00 3.00{TRP |2 TIH F/ 12740’ - 14817' & CIRC BU, 5' FLARE
00:00 - 02:00 200[TRP |2 TiH F/ 14817° TO 17114', W&R 194' TO BOTTOM, 15' OF FILL LAST 20' PRETTY
SNUG.
02:00 - 05:00 3.00[CIRC |1 CIRC BU, 10' FLARE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00|CIRC |1 SPOT 228 BBL OF 17.5 MUD ON BOTTOM.
6/11/2007  |06:00 - 11:00 5.00|TRP |2 TOH TO 11279', ROTATED OUT FIRST 7 STANDS, NEXT 5 STANDS WERE
TIGHT. PULLED 60 STANDS.
11:00 - 13:00 2.00[CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP TO CLEAN UP GAS, RU LD MACHINE, PUMP PILL,
13:00 - 21:30 8.50|TRP |3 LDDP, TO BHA
21:30 - 23:30 2.00{TRP |2 RD LD POLE & TIH W/ 60 STANDS OF DP.

Printed: 7/2/2007 1:06:47 PM




QuestarE & P Page 24 of 25

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

Spud Date:  1/24/2007

Location: 4-8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code Cs:dl:a Description of Operations

6/11/2007 | 23:30 - 06:00 6.50 RU LD POLE & LD DP

6/12/2007 | 06:00 - 07:30 150|TRP |2 LDDP & DCS
07:30 - 08:00 0.50| OTH DRAIN STACK & PULL WEAR BUSHING
08:00 - 10:30 2.50/CcsG |1 RU ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASERS HOLD SAFETY MEETING
10:30 - 14:30 4.00/CSG |2 PU & RUN 4 1/2" 15.1# Q-125 & P-110 FILL PIPE @ 220, 1270' & 5175’

14:30 - 15:00 0.50|CIRC |1 CIRC & COND MUD F/ BOTTOMS UP.

15:00 - 16:30 150{csG |2 RUN P-110 TO 7604', BROKE AIR LINE ON HIGH CLUTCH

16:30 - 19:00 250{RIG |2 FILL PIPE & CIRC WHILE REPAIRING AIR LINE, PUT AIR TO CLUTCH & LINE
BLEW OFF AGAIN. WOULD NOT HAVE SHUT DOWN TO FILL PIPE IF WE
HADN'T BROKE DOWN.

19:00 - 22:30 350|CSG |2 RUN P-110 TO 12223'

22:30 - 01:30 3.00[CIRC |1 FILL PIPE & CIRC BOTTOMS UP, WORK ON HIGH CLUTCH WHILE
CIRCULATING.

01:30 - 02:30 1.00{CSG |2 RUN P-110 to 14327

02:30 - 04:00 1.50{CIRC |1 FILL PIPE & CIRC, 3000u GAS, 12' BRIEF FLARE.

04:00 - 05:30 1.50{CSG |2 RUN P-110 TO 15440’

05:30 - 06:00 0.50|CIRC |1 FILL PIPE & CIRC BOTTOMS UP.

6/13/2007  |06:00 - 08:00 2.00|CIRC |1 CIRC BOTTOMS UP, @ 14440’ 2-5' FLARE

08:00 - 09:30 150[{cse |2 FINISH RUNNING THE LAST OF THE P-110, MU LJ .

09:30 - 10:00 0.50| OTH PULL ROTATING HEAD

10:00 - 10:30 0.50| REAM |1 WAHED 8 TO GET ROTATING RUBBER INTO HEAD

10:30 - 11:00 0.50| OTH INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER IN BODY

11:00 - 12:00 1.00| REAM |1 TRYED TO WASH TO BOTTOM, BUT COULDN'T MOVE PIPE DOWN, SETTING
TOOL RIGHT UNDER ROTATING RUBBER, CAN'T MOVE UP, FLUTED HANGER
HUNG UP IN STACK. CLOSED ANNULAR TO CENTER UP PIPE CAME LOOSE,
WASHED UN TIL WE CAN'T GET ANY PRESSURE INCREASE NO MATTER
WHAT WE DO. WILL CIRC OUT GAS & TRY TO PULL 10' JT FROM UNDER
HANGER.

12:00 - 14:00 2.00|CIRC |1 CIRC OUT GAS

14:00 - 14:30 0.50| OTH PULL ROTATING HEAD

14:30 - 15:00 050{CSG |2 LD 10' PUP JT

15:00 - 15:30 0.50| OTH INSTALL ROTATING HEAD

15:30 - 17:00 1.50{CSG |2 WASH BOTTOM, TRYING TO WASH TO CSG. HEAD, PIPE APPEARS TO BE
STUCK, AND NOT ENOUGH ROOM TO WORK WITH HANGER & ROTATING
HEAD, STRING WT. TO HANGER 42", 30K WILL NOT PRESSURE UP OR PULL
FREE.

17:00 - 21:30 as0/cMT |1 RU HES & CIRC W/ RIG PUMP

21:30 - 00:30 3.00/CMT {2 CHANGE OVER & TEST LINES TO 8K, PUMP 10 BBL OF CLAY FIX, 30 BBL OF
TUNED SPACER, 865 SX OF CLASS "G", WT. 16 PPG, YIELD 1.49, 229 BBL OF
SLURRY, DROP PLUG & DISPLACE W/ 10 BBL OF FRESH WATER, 146 BBL OF
26.5% KCL WATER, WT 9.5 PPG. DID NOT BUMP PLUG, FLOATS DID NOT
HOLD, SI W/ 4100 PSI. DISPLACEMENT PRESSURE HIT 8600 PSI, BLEED OFF
TO 4100 & SI.

00:30 - 06:00 5.50| WOT |1 SI CSG HEAD & WOC, MONITOR PRESSURES ON CSG & BACK SIDE. BACK
SIDE PSI = 540, CSG PRESSURE UK CSG HEAD LEAKING.

- PICKED UP & RAN 79 JTS OF 4 1/2" 15.1# Q-125 LT&C, 304 JTS OF 4 1/2" 15.1#
P-110, LT&C, RAN MARKER JTS @ 12000' & 13000". RAN 55 CENTRALIZERS
EVERY 3rd JT TO 12500' THEN EVERY 4th JT UNTIL 556 WERE IN THE HOLE.
STACKED FLOAT COLLAR & SHOE W/ WEATHERFORD COLLETTE & LATCH
DOWN PLUG.

6/14/2007 | 06:00 - 06:30 0.50| OTH SICP 550, BLEED OFF, BLEED OFF CSG. BACK SIDE FLOWING 1/4" STREAM
06:30 - 09:30 3.00{OTH GRIND OUT MASTER BUSHINGS MONITOR BACK SIDE FLOW, S| AFTER 1 HR.
|
I
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Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Location:  4- 8-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 24
Date From - To | Hours | Code ng’dbe Description of Operations
6/14/2007  |09:30 - 12:30 3.00[BOP |1 RU IPS BOP LIFTS, ND BOP
12:30 - 13:30 100/CSG |7 OPEN BACK SIDE W/ 850 PSI, FLOWING 17 BPH, LIFT STACK, SET SLIPS W/
26KI NDICATED STRING WT. MAKE ROUGH CUT.
13:30 - 14:30 1.00({BOP |1 RESET STACK, FLUTED MANDREL HANGING IN STACK.
14:30 - 18:00 3.50| OTH RD IPS, RU HARD LINE TO DITCH, INSTALL BULL PLUG, NEEDLE VALVE & 5K

GAUGE, OPEN WING VALVE, OPEN NEEDLE VALVE, 1600 PSI ON BS,
MONITOR PRESSURES & BLEED OFF EVERY HR. LD LANDING JT W/
HANGER CLEAN FLOOR LD 4" TOOLS.

18:00 - 19:00 1.00( OTH HOOK UP & CLOSE BLIND RAMS.

19:00 - 23:00 4.00| OTH INSTALL BLOCK VALVE BEHIND WING VALVE & MONITOR PERSSURES.
CLEAN SUB, & BOP.

23.00 - 02:.00 3.00|OTH DRY GAS TO SURFACE, S| PRESSURES TO 2800. NU BOPE TO GO TROUGH
CHOKE, CLOSE BOTTOM PIPE RAMS.

02:00 - 06:00 4.00| OTH VENT GAS F/ WING VALVE TO CHOKE THROUGH HARD LINE. 0200, 1200, 40’

FLARE, 0230, 1000, 40", 0300, 850, 40', 0330, 750, 35', 0400, 700, 35', 0430, 640,
35', 0500, 600, 30", .0530, 600, 30", 0600, 560, 30'.

6/15/2007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50| OTH VENT BACK SIDE TO FLARE PIT, 20-30' FLARE
09:30 - 10:00 0.50| OTH CHANGE OUT NIPPLES ON WING VALVE, ADD 2- HALLIBURTON VALVES
| DOWN STREAM FROM WING VALVE, WING VALVE WASHED.
110:00 - 16:00 6.00| OTH MONITOR PRESSURES ON BACK SIDE.
116:00 - 18:00 2.00{ CMT 1 HALLIBURTON ON LOCATION @ 16:10, RU TO ESTABLISH INJECTION RATE.

HOLD SAFETY MEETING. TEST BREAKS IN BOP TO 5K, BLEED TO 4.8K SLOW
NO LEAKS FOUND.

18:00 - 23.00 5.00| CMT 2 [RESSURE TEST LINES TO 6.5K, PUMPED 41.3 BBL & SD F/ PSI, LOST 500 PSI
IN 19 MIN. PUMPED BACK UP TO 6.5K, 5.5 BBL, SD, LOST 64 PSI IN 39 MIN.
PUMP .5 BBL & SD, SIW

23:00 - 00:30 1.50{ OTH VENT BACK SIDE TO CHOKE & MONITOR PRESSURES. OPENED WITH 6400
AND A 45' FLARE
00:30 - 06:00 5.50(LOC 4 RDRT, RIG DOWN PUMP, DUMP PITS & RD BACK YARD. PR PRESSURE @
05:30 3450 PSI. 35' FLARE.
6/16/2007 06:00 - 19:00 13.00|LOC 4 VENT BACK SIDE GAS, CLAN MUD TANKS & RDRT, SHUT IN @ 18:45 W/ 1150
PSI.

- PRESSURES: 0600, 3300, 30' FLARE., 0700, 3100, 30", 0800, 2900, 30', 0900
2800, 25', 1000, 2900, 20", 1100, 2750, 20, 1200, 2500, 20', 1300, 2250, 20", 1400,
1900, 20', 1600, 1500, 15-20' 1700, 1400, 15/20", 1845, S| WELL, 1150, 25'.
MONITOR BACK SIDE PRESSURES W, FLOW BACK CREW. SEEMS TO BE A
LOT OF CONDENSATE, & WHEN IT COMES THE FLARE GETS LARGER &
HOTTER.

MONITOR BUILD UP & RDDT PRESSURE @ 0145 2525, 35' FLARE.

VENT BACK SIDE GAS TO CHOKE, OPENNED @ 0145 W/ 2525 PSI. 0300, 35'
FLARE, 0400, 1900, 30", 0500 1750, 255', 0600, 1600, 25' FLARE.

6/17/2007 06:00 - 15:00 9.00(LOC 4 RDRT, FLARE BACK SIDE GAS THROUGH CHOKE & MONITOR PRESSURES.
RELEASE RIG @ 15:00 6/17/07, TURN OVER TO SALES @ 1500, 1700 PSI,
2.7MM/D. READY F/ TRUCKS.

00:00 - rig phone forwarded to my cell, 435-828-1687

19:00 - 02:00 7.00|LOC
02:00 - 06:00 4.00{LOC

L Y
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(June 1990)

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
UTU-02510A

. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

N/A
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Amended Report on 1/15/07 [. 17 Unit or CA, Agresment Designation
1. Typeof Well WHITE RIVER UNIT
Qi Gas :
D well Well D Other |F- Well Name and No.
GB1M 48 22R

2. Name of Operator

QEP, UINTA BASIN, INC. . APl Well No. . .
3 Address and Telephone No. Contact: Dahn.Caldwell@questar.com 43-047-339900% M
1571 East 1700 South, VERNAL, UT 84078 435-781-4342 Fax 435-781-4357 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4, Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) WHITE RIVER
1147’ FNL, 474° FWL, LOT 8, SEC 4-T8S-R22E I County or Parish, Stale
UINTAH
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF ACTION

TYPE OF SUBMISSION
D Abandonment

D Notice of Intent
D Recompletion

E Subsequent Report D Plugging Back

D Casing Repair
D Final Abandonment Notice D Altering Casing

Oer  SPUD

D Change of Plans
D New Construction
D Non-Routine Fracturing
D Water Shut-Off
D Conversion to Injection
D Dispose Water

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or R letion Report and L;lfom.)

13.  Describe Proposed or Completed Op (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give perti dates, includi
give

bsurface locations and d and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

d date of starting any proposed work. I well is directionally drifled,

On 1/24/07 - Drilled 17-1/2” hole. Ran 12 jts of 13-3/8”, J-55, 54.5# csg. Cmtd w/ 500 sxs Class “G” cmt.

3 - BLM, 2- Utah OG&M, 1 - Denver, 1 — file Word file-server

I AN,

RECEIvED
JUL 2 0 2007
DIV OF OIL, GAS & Mg

X

e—_—

nmm— —
14. 1hereby certify that the foregoing is \{rue and

Signed Tyahn F. Caldwe ice Administator 11

Date - 3/16/07

et —————————————

T —————————————

(This space for Federal or State office use)
Approved by: Title

Conditions of approval, if any E £ % } “ g :

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it & crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Date

se, fictitious or fraudulent statements or




CC T

Questar E & P Page 1 0of4

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R
4-8-S 22-E 26
Rig Name: ENSIGN

Location:

Y/3-0497-38770

Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Number: 24

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

6/28/2007

6/29/2007

6/30/2007

7112007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

Loc

BOP

DRL

DRL

4

On 6/27/07 - Initial Completion Report.

7:00 AM Conduct safety meeting. MIRU IPS Flow Back Equipment. Spectrum fluid

ser Zeco pit & shaker.

2:00 PM - MIRU Bronco Flow Cross BOP HCR Master Valve. IPS CTU Fluid pump.
MU Lubricator. NU WH. Chain down & secure well.

24 Hour Forecast: Starting in hole to drill out cement.

On 6/28/07 - 7:00 AM Conduct safety meeting. Unchain ND lubicator from WH. MU
Baker BHA. CTC pull test 25K. MU 2-7/8" jars. MU CT disc circ sub. MUMTR 3
tooth drag bit. Surface test MTR, circ sub opened replaced circ sub. Retest it
opened. Replaced got good surface test. NU on WH test - all lines & WH
equipment to 8000 psi BO Open well.

10:00 AM - Start in hole pumping 5 BPM to 2 BPM tag cement @ 10861’ fell through
ClH to 11015'. Fell through CIH to 11378'. Started drilling hard cement at 11401'.
2:00 PM had gas bubble and approx 15 bbl mud - stop drilling CWC - got up rubber
plug debris. CIH to 11491".

5:00 PM MTR quit POOH had stater rubber in mill port. Secure well SDFN @ 7:00
PM. Total footage drilled 630,

24 Hour Forecast: Drill out cement.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#

Csg Depth: 17,083'

On 6/29/07 @ 6:00 AM Conduct safety Meeting. MU Baker BHA 2-7/8 MTR 3-5/8"
3 tooth drag bit. NU on WH test lines & WH equipment to 8K BO.

7:00 AM Open well. TIH tag @ 11500'. Start drilling cement.

9:30AM - 11,600".

11:30 AM - 11,860". PU of BTM, Sl csg psi to 3500 psi, surged back CiH drilling to
12651'. Sl csg psi up to 3500 surge back no fill. See pumping 2 BPM, pump 15
bbls gel sweeps CWC. POOH secure well.

7:00 PM - SDFN.

TOTAL FOOTAGE DRILLED TODAY = 1151’ - TOTAL 1781".
24 Hour Forecast: Drill out cement.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#

Csg Depth: 17,083

On 6/29/07 @ 6:00 AM Conduct safety Meeting. MU Baker BHA 2-7/8 MTR 3-5/8"
3 tooth drag bit. NU on WH test lines & WH equipment to 8K BO.

7:00 AM Open well. TIH tag @ 12652'. CIH Drilling cement 2-4 FPM to 13280".
1:30 PM - Top Bowen Union started leaking. PU of BTM moved crane around
would not stop PS! up to 800, would not stop. Close pipe rams. Pumped 15 bbls
gel sweep. CWC open rams, POOH, Sl well. ND Lubricate. ND Baker BHA. RD
lubricator, change all o-rings. RU lubricator. MU Baker BHA as same. 6:00 PM -
SDFN.

TOTAL FOOTAGE DRILLED TODAY = 628' - TOTAL 2409’

24 Hour Forecast: Drill out cement.

Printed: 8/3/2007 2:15:34 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R
4- 8-S 22-E 26
Rig Name: ENSIGN

Location:

Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Number: 24

Date From - To | Hours | Code Description of Operations

7/1/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( DRL Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#

Csg Depth: 17,083

7/2/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00{ DRL On 7/1/07, @ 6:00 AM Conduct Safety Meeting. BO 3 tooth drag mill. MU Baker
3.701 Carbide Hurricane mill. Surface test MTR, NU on WH test lines and WH
equipment to 8K BO Open Well. TIH Tag @ 13288'. CIH drilling cement @ .5to 1
FPM.

2:00 PM - Plugged choke w/ very course cut cement. Stop drilling pump. 15 BBL
gel sweep. Clean well. S| csg psi up to 3500 . Surge back, CIH drilling to 13860".
PU pump 15 BBL Sweep CWC. POOH. SI well. ND Lubricator BO 3.701
Hurricane mill. BO MTR. MU MTR. MU 3 tooth drag bit. NU on WH. Secure well.
SDFN @ 7:00 PM.

TOTAL FOOTAGE DRILLED TODAY = 572' - TOTAL 2981’

24 Hour Forecast: Drill out cement.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#

Csg Depth: 17,083'

7/3/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00( DRL On 7/2/07, 6:00 AM Conduct safety meeting. WHP 4-1/2 to 9-5/8 5000 surface.
Test MTR w/ 3-5/8 3 tooth drag mill test lines & WH equipment to 8K BO. Open
well - TIH pumping .5 to 2 BPM. Tag @ 13838". CIH drilling to 14838". PU Sl csg
psi up 3500 surge back. CIH drilling to 15001°. Pump 15 bbi gel sweep. CWC
POOH secure well clean and jet shaker pit full of cement. Replace 300 bbl of gel
system w/ fresh 2% & re-gel up. SDFN @ 9:00 PM. Will run full drift 3.701 3 tooth
drag mill in AM
TOTAL FOOTAGE DRILLED TODAY = 1163’ - TOTAL 4140
24 Hour Forecast: Drill out cement.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#%
Csg Depth: 17,083

7/4/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00| DRL On 7/3/07, 6:00 AM Conduct safety meeting. WHP 4-1/2 0 9-5/8" 5000. Surface
test MTR w/ 3.701 3 tooth drag mill, test lines & WH equipment to 8K - BO Open
well. TiH pumping .5 to 2 BPM. Tag @ 14984". CIH drilling to 15590". PU 300'.
Clean well up. CIH drilling picking up 50' for every 100" drilled. Pumping gel
sweeps every 50'. Drilled CIH to 16300'. Pump 15 bbl gel sweep CWC. POOH.
Secure well. ND lube BO mill & MTR. MU new MTR. MU same mill 3.701 . NU
WH. SDFN @ 8:00 PM.

TOTAL FOOTAGE DRILLED TODAY = 1316' - TOTAL = 5439'
24 Hour Forecast: Drill out cement.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 156.1#

Csg Depth: 17,083

7/5/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00/ DRL On 7/4/07 - 6:00 AM Conduct safety meeting. WHP 4-1/2 0 5200, Surface test MTR
w/ 3.701 3 tooth drag mill. Test line & WH equipment to 8K BO. Open well. PSI up
csg 3500 surge back. TIH pumping .5 to 2 BPM. Tag @ 16315'. CIH drilling ROP
2-4 picking up 50' for every 100" drilled. Pumping gel sweeps every 50'. Drilled CIH
to 17058'. Tag & stall. PU 50' RIH to 17058'. Tag & stall. PU off BTM pump 20
bbls 80 VIS Sweep. PU to 16000". Sl csg PSI to 3500 psi. Surge back. RIH circ 2
BTM up w/ 3 - 20 bbl 80 VIS Sweeps. To surface displace gel water w/ 191 bbl 2%

Printed: 8/3/2007 2:15:34 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:; GB 1M-4-8-22R
4-8-S 22-E 26
Rig Name: ENSIGN

Location:

Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Number: 24

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

7/5/12007

71712007

7/8/2007

7/10/2007

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

DRL

LOG

TRP

LOG

KCL. POOH. RDMO IPS CTU & Pumps 17058 + 22' KB 17080'". Clean & jet
spectrum tank.

TOTAL FOOTAGE DRILLED TODAY = 743' - TOTAL = 6197°
Relieved by Mike Hagen (580)254-4394.

24 Hour Forecast: Run cased hole logs.

Csg Size: 4-1/2"15.1%

Csg Depth: 17,083

On 7/6/07, @ 12:30 PM MIRU Schlumberger EWL, Crane. NU 4-1/16" x 15K
Crossover Flange on top of production tree. Open up master valves on tree to
check pressure on csg 0#. Make up 3.623" DT1 Cased Hole Logging Tools and
start in hole @ 5:00 PM. Engineer was going in hole too fast abd hit fluid @ 381'
and jumped line off shelve. Shut down to fix line and continue in hole with logging
tools and set down @ 16,095'. Work log tools up/down to try and get through spot.
Could not get through spot w/ repeated attempts. Called Mr. Stahl to inform him
where we set down at. POOH w/ logging tools and RDMO Schlumberger Logging
Truck, Crane. Secure well for the night and shut down.

24 Hour Forecast: MIRU IPS Coil Tbg Unit and RIH down to 16,095’ and clean out
to bottom.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#

Csg Depth: 17,083

On 7/7/07, MIRU IPS Coil Tubing Unit & pull test CC to 25K and pressure test to
2500#. Function test motor to @ 2.0 bbis 2800#. NU to production tree and RIH
with 2.88" x 2.375" Coil Connector, 2.88" x 2.375" Dual Back Pressure Valve, 2.88"
x 2.375" Bowen Coil Tubing Jars, 2.88" x 2.375" Hydraulic Disconnect, 2.88" x
2.375" Dual Circulation Valve, 2.88" x 2.375" VIP NaviDrill Motor, X-Over Sub 2-3/8"
Reg x 2-3/8" PAC (BXP). RIH w/ coil tbg & hit a small bobble @ 16,093' only about
2K difference pushed right through and RIH down to 17,063’ & pick up 5' off bottom
& pump 10 bbis FR Pill. Circulate bottoms up & POOH with C/T & shut production
tree in. RD C/T Unit. SDFWE.

24 Hour Forecast: Leave C/T on standby for Monday if Bond Log won't go through.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#

Csg Depth: 17,083

On 7/9/07, MIRU Cutters EWL and NU 4-1/18" x 15K x 10 K crossover spool. RIH
w/ 3.625" GR/JB down to 17,065' (EWL Measurement) & POOH w/ same. Had few
pieces of cement in JB on surface. RIH w/ CCL/2.375" CBL tool down to PBTD &
start pulling bond log holding 2000# pressure @ 14,000' CBL quit working. POOH
& fixed bond tools. RIH back down to 14,000' where tool quit working and start
logging again. Pull CBL up to 5000' per Mr. Stahl's instructions. Shut down logging
& POOH w/ CBL tools & secure well. RDMO EWL, Hot Oiler.

TOC @ 12,610' 20-30% bond down to 13,200'. Excellent cement from 13,200
down to 17,065' 95-100% bond.

24 Hour Forecast: MIRU PLS EWL to run Temp & Noise Survey.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#%

Printed: 8/3/2007 2:15:34 PM
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Operations Summary Report

Location:
Rig Name:

Weil Name: GB 1M-4-8-22R

4-8-8 22-E 26

ENSIGN

Spud Date:  1/24/2007
Rig Release: 6/16/2007
Rig Number: 24

Date

From - To

Hours

Code

Sub
Code

Description of Operations

7/10/2007
7/11/2007

7/12/2007

7/15/2007

06:00 - 16:00
06.00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

06:00 - 16:00

10.00(LOG
10.00| LOG

10.00

10.00

LOG

LOG

4

Csg Depth: 17,083

On 7/10/07 MIRU PLS EWL Truck, Mast. NU 4-1/16" x 15K x 5K flange on top of
production tree. RIH w/ CCL, 1-3/4" Temp & Noise Tool down to 15,000". Pull back
up to 12,000' and open up surface valve through Parchmans flow manifold to tank
20/64" choke 6000# pressure. BHT @ 12,000' was 219*F with well flowing to tank.
Pressure had dropped down to 4500# 219*F. Slickline operator was adjusting trailer
mounted mast and crimped line and shorted out tools. Shut surface valve in and
POOH w/ tools. Secure well fo rthe night.

24 Hour Forecast: MIRU PLS EWL to rerun Temp & Noise Survey. No cost for
wireline services today.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#

Csg Depth: 17,083

On 7/11/07, MIRU PLS EWL., Mast, check surface pressure 4500#. Open up
surface through Parchman's manifold to tank 20/64" choke. RIH w/ CCL, 1-3/8"
Temp & Noise Tool down to 5000’ and record temp -122*F for 25 minutes. RIH
down to 15,000 to start base log. Pull back up to 9100’ and log back down and @
approx. 9500’ log was showing gas entry. Continue down hole down to 10,000' and
stop. Pull through spot @ 9500' with the same results. Pult up to 5000° and turn on
noise log and continue down hole stopping every 100’ to record noise. Stop @ top
of 7" liner and record noise level (No change). Continue down hole to 9100
stopping in 50 intervals. Stop @ 9400’ and noise level and temp were changing.
Continue down to 9475’ and stop and record temp/noise level. Called Mr. Stahl to
inform him that gas entry according to noise log was @ 9475'. RIH down to 12,620°
below 7" liner and record noise levels. No gas entry was showing up on temp/noise
log. POOH w/ tools and shut surface valve in and secure well.

24 Hour Forecast: Clean up log & sned to Denver.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#%

Csg Depth: 17,083

On 7/14/07, MIRU Schlumberger EWL Services, Crane. RIH w/ 3.56" GR/JB down
to PBTD @ 17,085". Start POOH w/ CCL, GR, JB and @ 16,550' JB was pulling
tight with approx 1200# of tension over. Called Mr. Stahl to inform him of tight spot.
Schlumberger will stay above tight spot and pull Sonic Image Tool from 16,500’ -
12,600' and Gamma Ray/Neutron log from 12,600' up to 5,000'. POOH w/ tools and
secure well RDMO Schlumberger.

6:00 AM on 7/15/07 - Operator was pulling 200" repeat pass and will RDMO this AM.
JB had thin peices of cement in it on surface.

24 Hour Forecast: Process and send logs to Denver for evaluation.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 15.1#
Csg Depth: 17,083

Printed: 8/3/2007 2:15:34 PM
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Form approved.

(November 1983) UNITED STATES SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE Budget Bureau No. 1004-0137
(formerly 9-330) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR (See other in- Expires August 31, 1985
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGMENT ™ structions on
L ! reverse side). 5.  LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
Lo UTU-02510A
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG *
la. TYPE OF WELL oL GAS 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
WELL [':_| WELL ;z DRY I:I Other WHITE RIVER UNIT
b TYPE OF COMPLETION
' NEW WORK DEEP- PLUG DIFF. 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
WELL M OVER D EN l____l BACK D RESVR I:] Other N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 9. WELLNO.
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. GB1M 48 22R
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. Contact: Dahn Caldwell 435-781-4342 10.  FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH - VERNAL, UT 84078 Fax # 435.781.4357
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements)* UNDESIGNATED
Atsurface 1147’ FNL, 474’ FEL, NENE, SEC 4-T8S-R22E 11. SEC.T.R.M.ORBLOCK AND SURVEY
OR AREA
At top rod. interval reported below 1147’ FNL, 474° FEL, NENE, SEC 4-T8S-R22E SEC 4-T8S-R22E
At total depth 1147° FNL, 474’ FEL, NENE, SEC 4-T8§S-R22E
14,  PERMITNO. DATE ISSUED 12.  COUNTY OR 13.  STATE
PARISH
43-047-38990 UINTAH UT
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (Ready io prod,) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GR, ETC)* | 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD
1/24/07 6/6/07 8/9/07 KB
20, TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
HOW MANY* DRILLED BY
17,114° 17,063’ —> X
24, PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION~TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADE
See Attachment Page One
NO
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN = 27. WAS WELL CORED
BondLog (112, SO SING® Pox Tdi . BT _1BCS NO
28. CASING RECORD rt all strings set in well)
CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LBJFT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED
13-3/8” 54.5# 526° 17-1/2” 500 SXS
9-5/8” 47# 6107’ 12-1/4” 1427 SXS
4-1/2” 15.1# 17,083° 6-1/8” 865 SXS
29. LINER RECORD 30, TUBING RECORD
_SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)
77 5576 12,612’ 1400 SXS N/A
31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and number) 32, ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
SEE PERFORATION DETAIL ATTACHMENT PAGE ONE DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED
See Attachment Page 1 See Attachment Page One
33 PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gas lift, pumping—size and type of pump) WELL STATUS (Producing or
shut-in)
8/10/07 FLOWING PRODUCING
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N FOR OIL-BBL. GAS—MCF. WATER~BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO
TESTPERIOD
8/12/07 24 16 > 12 ] 4236 { 1514
FLOW. TUBING PRESS. | CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL-BBL. GAS-MCF WATER—BBL OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR )
24-HOUR RATE
N/A 6800 > . ——
34, DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, used for fuel, vented, eic.) HREURI VL] TsSTWITNESSEDBY
SOLD
35. LISTOF ATTACHMENTS OCT 1 1 200
WELLBORE SCHEMATIC & PERFORATION DETAIL ATTACHMENT ; 7
36. 1hereby certify that the foregoing and atta infmaﬁowm@@)ﬂ available records
SIGNED JIM SIMONTON TITLE COMP[RM(Q& SUPERVISOR. . - DATE 16/1/07

(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

TInited Statec anv fales firtitiane ar frandnlent ctatementc ar renreeentationg ac tn anv matter within ite iuriq@@NF!DENTI L
i <-4 A
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GB 1M 4-8-22 — Perforation Detail Attachment

PERFORATION DETAIL:

Open Perfs

13383' - 13385’
13442 - 13444’
13503 - 13505’
13516’ - 13518’

13554’ — 13556"

13692' - 13694’

113823 - 13825’
13876’ — 13878

13947 - 13949’
14049' - 10451'

14101’ - 14103’

14110' - 14112 |

141 54’ — 14156’

14258 - 14262

14296’ - 14302'
| 14392’ — 14394’

S S
14617 - 14619'

14648’ - 14650'
14758 — 14760’

Tieew 07 [
14908’ - 14910"

115048’ — 1505