
PERilITC0
14421 County Rd. 10 - Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621 • (303) 857-9999 • FAX(303) 857-0577 • E-MAILPermitco 1@aoLcom

November28, 2006

DivisionofOil,Gas&Mining
1594 WestNorthTemple,Suite1210
Box145801
SaltLakeCity,UT 84114-5801

Attn: DianaWhitney
Re: GascoProductionCompany

UtelandFederal#42-11-10-18
1591'FNLand314' FEL
SE NESection11,T108- R18E
UintahCounty,Utah

Diana,

Ple(se notethatthis tocatio as stakedatnon-stan¢Iardspécingin accordanceWiththe rulesand
regulationsofthgUtahRivisionofQilÃaçand Mining.Thiswasdone forgeologigconsiderationA Please
also notethat GascoProduction Companyigthaonlyworkingi torestownerwithina 460 foot radius.
Therefore,werequestyour administrativeapprovalofthisexceptionto spacing.

Ifyoushouldneedadditionalinforination,pleasedop'thesitatetocontactme

Sincerely,

PE IN

Venessa Langmacher
Consultantfor
GascoProductionCompany RECENED

Enc. g20$
cc: GascoProductionCompany- Englewood,CO og GAS&

ShawnElworthy- Roosevelt,UT
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O O
- STATE OF UTAH FORM 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT O

(highlight changes)

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
UMINERALL E9NO.: 6 SULRACE:

7. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
1A TYPEOFWORK DRILLË REENTER O DEEPEN O

N/A
B TYPE OF WELL; OILO GAS OTHER SINGLEZONEO MULTIPLEZONE 8. (JNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company UtelandFederal#42-11-10-18
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILOCAT:

8 Inverness DriveEast, Suite100, Englewood,CO80112 303-483-0044 M QSf(LVlff Ñv-RY
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE

MERIDIAN:

ATSURFACE:gge 1591 Land314' FEL Sec.11,T10S-R18E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: SE NE gy | 7 p

14 DISTANCE IN MILES AND DlRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

Approximately27.2milessoutheastofMyton,UT Uintah Utah
15 DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16 NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

314' 1920.00 40 Acres; SE NE
18 DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)

Approx.75'0(ShutIn) 12,325' Bond#UT-1233
21 ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER OF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTlMATED DURATION:

4932' GL ASAP 35 Days

24 PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASINGSIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT

17-1/2" 13-3/8", H40, 48# 200' 200sx PremiumType5, 15.6ppg,1.18yield
12-1/4" 8-5/8",J-55, 32# 3,333' 549sx Hi-Lift,11 ppg,3.91yield&185sx 10·2RFC,14.2ppg,1.63yield
7-7/8" 4-1/2",P110,13.5# 12,325' 523sx Hi-Lift,11.5ppg, 3.05yield &1169sx 50-50Poz, 14.1ppg, 1.28yield

2s ATTACHMENTS
VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OlL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRlLLING PROGRAM

EVIDENCE OF DiVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

AGENT: PermitCoInc. AGENT'S PHONE NO.: 303-857-9999

NAME (PLEASE P T) VenOSs Langmacher TlTLE AgentÍ0f Û8SCO ProductionCompany

SIGNATURE DATE November28,2006
(This space for State use only)

A) Approvedby the RECEIVED
API NUMBER ASSIGNED: / 8~¾1 UtaPreivision of

OS,Gas and Mining ggy3O2006

(11/2001) Federaf Approval of this (see instr nso s DN.0F0\L,GAS&MIN\NG
Action is Necessary ÛSÌO¾
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GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANYT10S RiBE S.L B.&M.
Well location, UTELAND FEDERAL#42-11-10-18, located as shown in theS8946'447 - 2634.80' (Meas.) SB9°49'287

- 2644.28' (Meas.) er s cap
SE 1/4 NE 1/4 of Section 11, T10S, R18E, evero sross ca, reto erass cP S.L.B.&M., Uintah County, Utah.1.0' High, Pile of 1.5' HAph, PHe

Stones, Steet Post of Stones

BASIS OF ELEVATION
SPOT ELEVATIONAT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF
SECTION 6, T10S, R19E, S.L.B.&M., TAKEN FROM THE
MOON BOTTOM QUADRANGLE,UTAH, 7.5 MINUTEQUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES-------

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY.
SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 5011 FEET.UTELANDFEDERÆ /'42-11-10-18

2,4
E/ev. Groded Ground = 4932'

Marked Stone, 5/8"
Set Marked Stone,Rebar 7.0' HigA Pile
Ple of Stones, Nof Stones, Steel Post
Stee/ Post

o oo
^o

o

SCALE

CERTIFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME AR RECT O THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BELI /

1910 Brass CaP
1970 Brass Cap20' High, PRe Set Marked Stone' 1.5' HgA Pfe of L VEof Stones Pile of Stones Stones, Steel Post

SB938'07"E - 26J6.12'(Meas.) SB944'50"E - 263774'(Meas.)
'' REVISED: 06-21-06

BASIS OF BEARINGS ONTAH SGINEERING G
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. BS SOUTH 200 FAST - 84078

LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUSNAD 83) (801) 789-1017
LATITUDE= 39 57'40.68" (39.961300) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

=
90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109°51'09.25" (109.852569) 1" = 1000' 04-13-06 04-19-06

(AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES
= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE = 39'57°40.81"

(39.961336) J.W. J.K. P.M. G.L.O. PLATA = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGlTUDE= 109'51'O6.73" (109.851869) WEATHER FILE

WARM GASCO PRODUCTION

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANYT10S RiBE S.L B.&M.
Well location, UTELAND FEDERAL#42-11-10-18, located as shown in theS8946'447 - 2634.80' (Meas.) SB9°49'287

- 2644.28' (Meas.) er s cap
SE 1/4 NE 1/4 of Section 11, T10S, R18E, evero sross ca, reto erass cP S.L.B.&M., Uintah County, Utah.1.0' High, Pile of 1.5' HAph, PHe

Stones, Steet Post of Stones

BASIS OF ELEVATION
SPOT ELEVATIONAT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF
SECTION 6, T10S, R19E, S.L.B.&M., TAKEN FROM THE
MOON BOTTOM QUADRANGLE,UTAH, 7.5 MINUTEQUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES-------

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY.
SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 5011 FEET.UTELANDFEDERÆ /'42-11-10-18

2,4
E/ev. Groded Ground = 4932'

Marked Stone, 5/8"
Set Marked Stone,Rebar 7.0' HigA Pile
Ple of Stones, Nof Stones, Steel Post
Stee/ Post

o oo
^o

o

SCALE

CERTIFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME AR RECT O THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BELI /

1910 Brass CaP
1970 Brass Cap20' High, PRe Set Marked Stone' 1.5' HgA Pfe of L VEof Stones Pile of Stones Stones, Steel Post

SB938'07"E - 26J6.12'(Meas.) SB944'50"E - 263774'(Meas.)
'' REVISED: 06-21-06

BASIS OF BEARINGS ONTAH SGINEERING G
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. BS SOUTH 200 FAST - 84078

LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUSNAD 83) (801) 789-1017
LATITUDE= 39 57'40.68" (39.961300) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

=
90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109°51'09.25" (109.852569) 1" = 1000' 04-13-06 04-19-06

(AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES
= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE =

39'57°40.81"
(39.961336) J.W. J.K. P.M. G.L.O. PLATA = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGlTUDE= 109'51'O6.73" (109.851869) WEATHER FILE

WARM GASCO PRODUCTION

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANYT10S RiBE S.L B.&M.
Well location, UTELAND FEDERAL#42-11-10-18, located as shown in theS8946'447 - 2634.80' (Meas.) SB9°49'287

- 2644.28' (Meas.) er s cap
SE 1/4 NE 1/4 of Section 11, T10S, R18E, evero sross ca, reto erass cP S.L.B.&M., Uintah County, Utah.1.0' High, Pile of 1.5' HAph, PHe

Stones, Steet Post of Stones

BASIS OF ELEVATION
SPOT ELEVATIONAT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF
SECTION 6, T10S, R19E, S.L.B.&M., TAKEN FROM THE
MOON BOTTOM QUADRANGLE,UTAH, 7.5 MINUTEQUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES-------

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY.
SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 5011 FEET.UTELANDFEDERÆ /'42-11-10-18

2,4
E/ev. Groded Ground = 4932'

Marked Stone, 5/8"
Set Marked Stone,Rebar 7.0' HigA Pile
Ple of Stones, Nof Stones, Steel Post
Stee/ Post

o oo
^o

o

SCALE

CERTIFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME AR RECT O THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BELI /

1910 Brass CaP
1970 Brass Cap20' High, PRe Set Marked Stone' 1.5' HgA Pfe of L VEof Stones Pile of Stones Stones, Steel Post

SB938'07"E - 26J6.12'(Meas.) SB944'50"E - 263774'(Meas.)
'' REVISED: 06-21-06

BASIS OF BEARINGS ONTAH SGINEERING G
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. BS SOUTH 200 FAST - 84078

LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUSNAD 83) (801) 789-1017
LATITUDE= 39 57'40.68" (39.961300) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

=
90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109°51'09.25" (109.852569) 1" = 1000' 04-13-06 04-19-06

(AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES
= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE =

39'57°40.81"
(39.961336) J.W. J.K. P.M. G.L.O. PLATA = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGlTUDE= 109'51'O6.73" (109.851869) WEATHER FILE

WARM GASCO PRODUCTION



CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1

ApprovalofOperations on Onshore
Federaland IndianOil&Gas Leases

UtelandFederal #42-11-10-18
1591'FNLand 314' FEL

SE NESection 11,T10S- R18E
UintahCounty,Utah

Prepared For:

Gasco Production Company

By:

PERMITC0INC.
14421CountyRoad 10

Ft. Lupton,Colorado80621
303/857-9999

Copies SentTo:

3 - BureauofLand Management - Vernal,UT
1 - UtahDivisionofOil,Gas &Mining- SLC,UT re,
2 - GascoProductionCompany- Englewood,CO
1 - Shawn Elworthy- Roosevelt, UT g i

PElk
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APPLICATIONFORPERMITTOD ORREENTER

24. Attachments
The following, cornpleted in accordance with the requirernents of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Attached.

2. A Drilling Plan.
SeeAttached

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the SUPO shall be filed with the Appropriate Forest
Service Office.

See Surface UsePlanAttached.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see Item 20).
Bondcoveragefor thiswellis providedbyGascoProduction Company undertheirBLMBond No.Bond#UT-1233.

5. Operator certification.
Please be advisedthat Gasco Production Company is consideredto be the operatorofthe abovementionedwell.
GascoProductionCompanyagreestobe responsibleunderthetermsandconditionsofthelease for the operations
conductedupontheleased lands.

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the authorized

APPLICATIONFORPERMITTOD ORREENTER

24. Attachments
The following, cornpleted in accordance with the requirernents of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Attached.

2. A Drilling Plan.
SeeAttached

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the SUPO shall be filed with the Appropriate Forest
Service Office.

See Surface UsePlanAttached.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see Item 20).
Bondcoveragefor thiswellis providedbyGascoProduction Company undertheirBLMBond No.Bond#UT-1233.

5. Operator certification.
Please be advisedthat Gasco Production Company is consideredto be the operatorofthe abovementionedwell.
GascoProductionCompanyagreestobe responsibleunderthetermsandconditionsofthelease for the operations
conductedupontheleased lands.

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the authorized

APPLICATIONFORPERMITTOD ORREENTER

24. Attachments
The following, cornpleted in accordance with the requirernents of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Attached.

2. A Drilling Plan.
SeeAttached

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the SUPO shall be filed with the Appropriate Forest
Service Office.

See Surface UsePlanAttached.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see Item 20).
Bondcoveragefor thiswellis providedbyGascoProduction Company undertheirBLMBond No.Bond#UT-1233.

5. Operator certification.
Please be advisedthat Gasco Production Company is consideredto be the operatorofthe abovementionedwell.
GascoProductionCompanyagreestobe responsibleunderthetermsandconditionsofthelease for the operations
conductedupontheleased lands.

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the authorized



0 0
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ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1
ApprovalofOperationsonOnshore

FederalandIndianOilandGasLeases

Allleaseand/orunitoperationswillbeconductedinsucha mannerthatfullcomplianceismadewithapplicable
laws,regulations(43CFR3100),OnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,andtheapprovedplanofoperations.The
operatorisfullyresponsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe furnished
thefieldrepresentativeto insurecompliance.

1. ESTIMATEDTOPSOFIMPORTANTGEOLOGICMARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea

Wasatch 4,845' +210'

Mesaverde 8,665' -3,610'

Castlegate 11,075' -6,020'

Blackhawk 11,335' -6,280'

SpringCanyon 12,025' -6,970'

TD 12,325' -7,270'

2. ESTIMATEDDEPTHOFANTICIPATEDWATER,OIL,GASORMINERALFORMATIONS:

Substance Formation Depth

Gas Wasatch 5,100'-8,665'

Gas Mesaverde 8,665'-11,075'

Gas Blackhawk 11,335'-12,225'

Allfreshwaterprospectivelyvaluablemineralsencounteredduringdrilling,willbe recorded
by depth and adequatelyprotected. Alloiland gas showswillbe testedto determine
commercialpotential.
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3. PRESSURECONTROLEQUIPMENT

GascoProductionCompany'sminimumspecificationsforpressurecontrolequipmentareas follows:

RamType: 11"Hydraulicdoublewithannular,5000psiw.p.

Ramtypepreventersandassociatedequipmentshallbe testedtoapprovedstackworkingpressure
if isolatedby test plugorto 70 percentof internalyieldpressure ofcasing. Pressure shallbe
maintainedforat least 10minutesoruntilrequirementsoftestaremet,whicheveris longer. Ifa test
plugis utilized,nobleed-offpressureisacceptable.Fora testnotutilizinga testplug,ifa declinein
pressureofmorethan10 percentin30 minutesoccurs,thetestshallbe consideredtohavefailed.
Valveoncasinghead belowtestplugshallbe openduringtestofBOPstack.

Annulartypepreventers(ifused)shallbe testedto50 percentofratedworkingpressure.Pressure
shallbe maintainedat least 10minutesor untilprovisionsoftestaremet,whicheveris longer.

Asa minimum,theabovetestshallbe performed:

a. wheninitiallyinstalled;
b. wheneveranysealsubjecttotestpressure is broken
c. followingrelatedrepairs;and
d. at 30-dayintervals

Valvesshallbe testedfromworkingpressure sideduringBOPEtestswithalldownstreamvalves
open.

Whentestingthekilllinevalve(s)thecheckvalveshallbe heldopenortheballremoved.

Annularpreventersshallbe functionallyoperatedat leastweekly.

Pipeandblindramsshallbe activatedeachtrip,however,thisfunctionneed notbe performedmore
thanoncea day.

ABOPEpitleveldrillshallbe conductedweeklyforeachdrillingcrew.

Pressure testsshallapplytoallrelatedwellcontrolequipment.

Alloftheabovedescribedtestsand/ordrillsshallbe recordedinthedrillinglog.
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BOPsystemsshallbe consistentwithAPIRP53. Pressuretestswillbe conductedbeforedrillingout
fromundercasingstringswhichhave been set andcementedinplace. Blowoutpreventercontrols
willbe installedpriortodrillingthesurfacecasingplugandwillremaininuseuntilthewelliscompleted
orabandoned.Preventerswillbe inspectedandoperatedat leastdailytoensuregoodmechanical
workingorder,and thisinspectionwillbe recordedon thedailydrillingreport. Preventerswillbe
pressuretestedbeforedrillingcasingcementplugs.

TheDistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientleadtime,inordertohavetheBLMrepresentative
on locationduringpressuretesting.

a. ThesizeandratingoftheBOPstackisshownontheattacheddiagram.Althougha righas
notbeen chosentodrillthiswell,mostoftheequipmentforthisdepthofholeintheareause
a 11",5000psiworkingpressureblowoutpreventor,

b. Achokelineanda killlinearetobe properlyinstalled.The killlineis _not tobe usedas a
fill-upline.

c. Theaccumulatorsystemshallhavea pressurecapacitytoprovideforrepeatedoperationof
hydraulicpreventers.

d. Drillstringsafetyvalve(s),tofitalltoolsinthedrillstring,aretobe maintainedontherigfloor
whiledrillingoperationsare inprogress.

4. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM:

a. The proposedcasingandcementingprogramshallbe conductedas approvedto protect
and/orisolateallusablewaterzones,potentiallyproductivezones,lostcirculationzones,
abnormallypressured zones,and any prospectivelyvaluabledeposits of minerals.Any
isolatingmediumotherthancementshallreceiveapprovalpriorto use. Thecasingsetting
depthshallbe calculatedtopositionthecasingseatoppositea competentformationwhich
willcontainthe maximumpressure to whichit willbe exposedduringnormaldrilling
operations.Determinationofcasingsettingdepth shallbe based on allrelevantfactors,
including;presencelabsence of hydrocarbons;fracture gradients; usablewaterzones;
formationpressures;lostcirculationzones;otherminerals;orotherunusualcharacteristics.
Allindicationsofusablewatershallbe reported.

b. Casingdesign shallassumeformationpressure gradientsof0.44 to 0.50 psi per footfor
exploratorywells(lackingbetterdata).
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c. Casingdesignshallassumefracturegradientsfrom0.70to1.00psiperfootforexploratory
wells(lackingbetterdata)

d. Casingcollarsshallhavea minimumclearanceof0.422inchesofallsides inthehole/casing
annulus,withrecognitionthatvariancescanbe grantedforjustifiedexceptions.

e. Allwaitingoncementtimesshallbe adequatetoachievea minimumof500psicompressive
strengthatthecasingshoepriortodrillingout.

f. Allcasingexcepttheconductorcasing,shallbe neworreconditionedandtestedusedcasing
thatmeetsorexceedsAPIstandardsfornewcasing.

g. Thesurfacecasingshallbe cementedbacktosurfaceeitherduringtheprimarycementjob
orby remedialcementing.

h. Allindicationsofusablewatershallbe reportedtotheauthorizedofficerpriortorunningthe
nextstringofcasingorbeforepluggingordersare requested,whicheveroccursfirst.

i. Three centralizerswillbe runonthebottom threejointsofsurfacecasingwitha minimumof
onecentralizerperjointstartingwiththeshoejoint.

j. Topplugsshallbe usedtoreducecontaminationofcementbydisplacementfluid.Abottom
plugorotheracceptabletechnique,suchas a suitablepreflushfluid,innerstringcement
method,etc.shallbe utilizedtohelpisolatethecementfromcontaminationbythemudfluid
beingdisplacedaheadofthecementslurry.

k. Allcasingstringsbelowtheconductorshallbe pressuretestedto0.22psiperfootofcasing
stringlengthor1500psi,whicheverisgreater,but nottoexceed70 percentoftheminimum
internalyield.Ifpressuredeclinesmorethan10percentin30minutes,correctiveactionshall
be taken.

l. Onallexploratorywells,andonthatportionofanywellapprovedfora 5MBOPEsystemor
greater,a pressure integritytestofeachcasingshoeshallbe performed.Formationat the
shoeshallbe testedtoa minimumofthemudweightequivalentanticipatedtocontrolthe
formationpressuretothenextcasingdepthorat totaldepthofthewell.Thistestshallbe
performedbeforedrillingmorethan20 feetofnewhole.
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m. The proposedcasingprogramwillbe as follows:

Purpose Depth HoleSize 0.0. Weight Grade Type New/Used

Conductor 0-200' 17-1/2" 13-3/8" 48# H-40 - New

Surface 0-3,333' 12-1/4" 8-5/8" 32# J-55 ST&C New

Production 0-12,325' 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 LT&C New

n. Casingdesignsubjecttorevisionbased ongeologicconditionsencountered.

o. Thecementprogramwillbe as follows:

Conductor TypeandAmount

Conductor 200sxsPremiumType5 @15.6ppg,1.18yield.

Surface TypeandAmount

Surface Lead:549sxHi-Lift@11.0ppg,3.91cuft/sk.
Tail:185sx 10-2RFC@14.2ppg, 1.63cuft/sk.

Production TypeandAmount

0-2,500' Lead:523sxHi-Lift@11.5ppg,3.05cuft/sk.
Tail:1169sx50/60POZ@14.1ppg, 1.28cuft/sk.

p. Anticipatedcementtopswillbe reportedas todepth;nottheexpectednumberofsacksof
cementtobe used. The DistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientleadtime,inorder
tohavea BLMrepresentativeonlocationwhilerunningallcasingstringsandcementing,

q. Aftercementingbutbeforecommencinganytest,thecasingstringshallstandcementeduntil
thecementhas reacheda compressivestrengthofat least 500 psiat theshoe. WOCtime
shallbe recordedinthedriller'slog.

r. Thefollowingreportsshallbe filedwiththeDistrictManagerwithin30 daysaftertheworkis
completed.
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1. Progress reports,Form3160-5(formerly9-331)"SundryNoticesand Reportson
Wells",mustincludecompleteinformationconcerning:

a. Settingofeachstringofcasing,showingthesize,grade,weightofcasing
set, holesize,settingdepth, amountsandtypeofcementused, whether
cementcirculatedor the top of the cementbehind the casing,depth of
cementingtoolsused, casingtestmethodand results,andthe date work
was done. Showthespuddate onthefirstreportssubmitted.

b. Temperatureorbondlogsmustbesubmittedforeachwellwherethecasing
cementwas notcirculatedtothesurface.

s. Auxiliaryequipmenttobe usedisas follows:

1. Kellycock

2. Nobitfloatis deemednecessary.

3. Asubwitha fullopeningvalve.

5. MUDPROGRAM

a. The proposedcirculatingmediumstobe employedindrillingareas follows:

Interval MudType MudWt. Visc. F/L pH

O'- 200' FreshWater 8.33 1 N/C 7

200' - 3,333' FreshWater 8.33 i N/C 7-8

3,333' - TD FreshWater&DAP 9.0 - 11.5 30 - 40 12 - 20 8

Therewillbe sufficientmudon locationtocontrola blowoutshouldoneoccur.
Amudtestshallbe performedevery24 hoursaftermuddinguptodetermine,as applicable:
density,viscosity,gelstrength,staticfiltrationloss,andPh.
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b. Mudmonitoringequipmenttobe usedis as follows:

1. Periodiccheckswillbe madeeachtourofthe mudsystem.The mudlevelwillbe
checkedvisually.

c. Nochromateadditiveswillbe usedinthemudsystemonFederaland/orlndianlandswithout
priorBLMapprovaltoensureadequateprotectionoffreshwateraquifers.

d. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitlelllinanamountequaltoorgreaterthan
10,000 pounds willbe used, produced,stored,transported,or disposed of annuallyin
associationwiththedrillingofthiswell. Furthermore,no extremelyhazardoussubstances,
as definedin40 CFR355, inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used, produced,stored,
transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

e. The use ofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformto43 CFR3610.2-3.

6. EVALUATIONPROGRAM

Theanticipatedtypeandamountoftesting,loggingandcoringareas follows:

a. Nodrillstemtestsareanticipated,however,ifDST'sarerun,thefollowingrequirementswill
be adheredto:

Initialopeningofdrillstemtesttoolsshallbe restrictedto daylighthours unless specific
approvaltostartduringotherhoursisobtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.However,DST's
maybe allowedtocontinueatnightifthetestwasinitiatedduringdaylighthoursandtherate
offlowis stabilizedand ifadequatelightingis available(i.e. lightingwhichis adequatefor
visibilityandvapor-proofforsafeoperations).Packerscanbe released,buttrippingshallnot
beginbeforedaylight,unlesspriorapprovalisobtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.Closed
chamberDSTsmaybe accomplisheddayornight.

ADSTthatflowstothesurfacewithevidenceofhydrocarbonsshallbe eitherreversedout
ofthetestingstringundercontrolledsurfaceconditions.Thiswouldinvolveprovidedsome
meansforreversecirculation.
Separationequipmentrequiredfortheanticipatedrecoveryshallbe properlyinstalledbefore
a teststarts.
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Allengineswithin100feetofthewellborethatarerequiredto"run"duringthetestshallhave
sparkarrestersorwatercooledexhausts.

b. Theloggingprogramwillconsistofa SchlumbergerPlatformExpressorequivalenttobe run
fromTD - base ofsurfacecasing.

c. Nocoresareanticipated.

d. Whether the well is completedas a dry hole or as a producer,"WellCompletionand
RecompletionReportandLog"(Form3160-4)willbe submittednotlaterthan30 daysafter
completionofthewelloraftercompletionofoperationsbeingperformed,inaccordancewith
43 CFR 3164. Twocopiesof all logs, coredescriptions,coreanalyses,well-testdata,
geologicsummaries,sampledescription,andallothersurveysordataobtainedandcompiled
duringthe drilling,workover,and/orcompletionoperations,willbe filedwithform3160-4.
Samples(cutting,fluids,and/orgases0willbe submittedwhenrequestedbytheauthorized
officer(AO).

e. Theanticipatedcompletionprogramwillbe totestPerformmultistageFracsandcompleteall
productiveBlackhawk,MesaverdeandWasatchsandspresentinwellbore.Produceallzones
commingled.

f. Dailydrillingand completionprogressreportsshallbe submittedtotheBLMinVernalon a
weeklybasis.

7. ABNORMALTEMPERATURESORPRESSURES

a, The expectedbottomhole pressure is 6902 psi. The maximumbottomhole temperature
anticipatedis210 degrees F.

b. Nohydrogensulfidegasisanticipated.Abnormalpressureswillbecontrolledwithmudweight
and5000#BOPandrotatinghead.

8. ANTICIPATEDSTARTINGDATESANDNOTIFICATIONOFOPERATIONS

a. Drillingwillcommenceimmediatelyuponapprovalofthisapplication.

b. Itisanticipatedthatthedrillingofthiswellwilltakeapproximately35 days.
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c. The BLMinVernal,Utahshallbe notifiedofthe anticipateddate of locationconstruction
commencementandofanticipatedspuddate.

d. Nolocationwillbe constructedormoved,nowellwillbe plugged,andnodrillingorworkover
equipmentwillbe removedfroma wellto be placed in a suspendedstatuswithoutprior
approvalof the AO. Ifoperationsare to be suspended,priorapprovaloftheAOwillbe
obtainedandnotificationgivenbeforeresumptionofoperations.

e. The spud date willbe reportedorallyto the AOwithin48 hours after spudding. Ifthe
spuddingoccursonaweekendorholiday,thereportwillbesubmittedonthefollowingregular
workday. Theoralreportwillbe followedupwitha SundryNotice.

f. InaccordancewithOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,thiswellwillbe reportedonForm3160-
6 "MonthlyReportofOperations",startingwiththemonthinwhichoperationscommenceand
continueeachmonthuntilthewellis physicallypluggedandabandoned.Thisreportwillbe
filedwiththeVernalBLMDistrictOffice,170South500 East,Vernal,UT 84078.

g. ImmediateReport:Spills,blowouts,fires,leaks,accidents,oranyotherunusualoccurrences
shallbe promptlyreportedinaccordancewiththerequirementsofNTL-3Aor itsrevision,

h. Ifa replacementrigiscontemplatedforcompletionoperations,a "SundryNotice"Form3160-
5 tothateffectwillbe filed,forpriorapprovaloftheAO,andallconditionsofthisapproved
planareapplicableduringalloperationsconductedwiththereplacementrig.

i. Shouldthewellbe successfullycompletedforproduction,theAOwillbe notifiedwhenthe
wellisplacedina producingstatus.Suchnotificationwillbe sentbytelegramorotherwritten
communications,not later than5 days followingthe date on whichthe well is placedon
production.

j. PursuanttoOnshoreOrderNo.7,withtheapprovaloftheDistrictEngineer,producedwater
maybe temporarilydisposedofintounlinedpitsfora periodofup to 90 days. Duringthe
periodsoauthorized,anapplicationforapprovalofthepermanentdisposalmethod,along
withtherequiredwateranalysisand otherinformation,mustbe submittedto the District
Engineer.

k. PursuanttoNTL-4A,lessees oroperatorsareauthorizedto·vent/flaregas duringinitialwell
evaluationtests,notexceedinga periodof30 days orthe productionof50 MMCFofgas,
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whicheveroccursfirst. Anapplicationmustbe filedwiththeDistrictEngineerandapproval
received,foranyventing/flaringofgasbeyondtheinitial30 day orauthorizedtestperiod.

l. Aschematicfacilitiesdiagramas requiredby43CFR3162.7-5(b.9.d.),shallbe submittedto
the appropriateDistrictOfficewithinsixty(60) days of installationor first production,
whicheveroccursfirst.Allsitesecurityregulationsas specifiedinOnshoreOrderNo.3 shall
be adheredto. Allproductlinesenteringand leavinghydrocarbonstoragetankswillbe
effectivelysealedinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.7-5(b.4.).

m. A first productionconferencewillbe scheduledwithin15 days afterreceiptofthe first
productionnotice.

n. Nowellabandonmentoperationswillbe commencedwithoutthepriorapprovaloftheAO.
Inthecase ofnewlydrilleddryholesorfailures,andinemergencysituations,oralapproval
willbe obtainedfromtheSO. A"SubsequentReportofAbandonment"Form3160-5,willbe
filedwiththeAOwithin30daysfollowingcompletionofthewellforabandonment.Thisreport
willindicatewhereplugswere placedandthe currentstatusofsurfacerestoration.Final
abandonmentwillnot be approveduntilthe sudace reclamationworkrequiredby the
approvedAPDorapprovedabandonmentnoticehas been completedtothesatisfactionof
theAOorhis representative,ortheappropriateSurfaceManagingAgency.

o. PursuanttoOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1, lessees andoperatorshavetheresponsibility
to see thattheirexploration,development,production,andconstructionoperationsare
conductedina mannerwhichconformswithapplicableFederallawsandregulationsandwith
State and local laws and regulationsto the extentthat such State and local laws are
applicabletooperationsonFederalor Indianlands.

Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078

Phone: 435/781-4400 ¯

Fax: 435/781-4410
After Hours:

Matt Baker Petroleum Engineer 435/828-4470

Michael Lee Petroleum Engineer 435/828-7875
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ONSHOREOlL&GASORDERNO.1
NOTIFICATIONREQUIREMENTS

LocationConstruction- forty-eight(48)hourspriortoconstructionoflocationandaccessroads.

LocationCompletion- priortomovingonthedrillingrig.

SpudNotice - atleast twenty-four(24)hourspriortospuddingthewell.

CasingStringand - twenty-four(24)hourspriorto runningcasingand
Cementing cementingallcasingstrings.

BOPandRelated - twenty-four(24)hourspriortoinitiatingpressuretests.
EquipmentTests

FirstProduction- withinfive(5)businessdays afternewwellbeginsor
Notice productionresumesafterwellhas been offproductionformorethan

ninety(90)days.

TheonsiteinspectionforthesubjectwellsitewasconductedonMonday,June 26, 2006at approximately
1:15p.m.Weatherconditionswerewarm,clearandbreezy. Inattendanceattheonsiteinspectionwere
thefollowingindividuals:

ChrisCarusona NaturalResourceSpecialist BureauofLandManagement
BrandonMcDonald WildlifeBiologist Bureauofland Management
MarilynWegweiser Geology&Paleo BureauofLandManagement
BekeeMcGown Botanist BureauofLandManagement
LarryEngland Botanist BureauofLandManagement
RandySmith FieldAssistant PermitcoInc.
ShawnElworthy FieldSupervisor GascoProductionCompany
Jesse Walton Surveyor UintahEngineeringand LandSurveying
BrianO'Hearn EnvironmentalScientist SWCA

1. EXISTINGROADS

a. The proposedwellsiteis locatedapproximately27.2milessoutheastofMyton,Utah.

PEIL
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b. DirectionstothelocationfromMyton,Utahareas follows:

ProceedsouthwesterlyonHighway40 for1.5miles.Turnleftandproceedsoutheasterly
forapproximately11milestotheCastlePeak Mine.Stayleftandproceedeast5.6 miles
on the8 mileFlatRoad. Turnrightandproceedsoutherly2.5 miles.Continue
southeasterly2.9 Miles.Turnrightandproceedsoutherly2.8 miles.Continueeasterly
0.5 miles.Turnrightandproceedsoutherly2.8 miles.Turnleftandproceedeasterly0.9
miles. Turnrightontotheproposednewaccessandproceedsoutheasterly200feet until
reachingtheproposedlocation.

c. Forlocationofaccessroadswithina 2-Mileradius,see MapsA&B.

d, Improvementtoexistingmainroadswillnotbe required.

e. Allexistingroadswillbe maintainedandkeptingoodrepairduringalldrillingand
completionoperationsassociatedwiththiswell.

f. Existingroadsandnewlyconstructedroadsonsurfaceunderthejurisdictionofany
SurfaceManagingAgencyshallbe maintainedinaccordancewiththestandardsofthe
SMA.

2. PLANNEDACCESSROADS

a. Approximately200feetofnewconstructionwillbe necessary.

b. The maximumgradeofthenewconstructionwillbe approximately3%.

c. Noculvertsor lowwatercrossingswillbe necessary.

d. The last200feet ofnewaccessroadwas centerlineflaggedat thetimeofstaking.

e. The useofsurfacingmaterialis notanticipated,howeveritmaybe necessarydepending
onweatherconditions.

f. Nocattleguardswillbe necessary.
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g. Surfacedisturbanceandvehiculartravelwillbe limitedtotheapprovedlocationand
approvedaccessroute.Anyadditionalareaneededwillbe approvedinadvance.

h. Accessroadsandsurfacedisturbingactivitieswillconformtostandardsoutlinedinthe
BureauofLandManagementandForestServicepublication:SurfaceOperating
StandardsforOilandGasExplorationandDevelopment,(1989).

i. The roadwillbe constructedlupgradedtomeetthestandardsoftheanticipatedtrafficflow
andallweatherroadrequirements.Construction/upgradingshallincludeditching,
draining,graveling,crowingandcappingtheroadbedas necessarytoprovidea well
constructedsaferoad. Priortoupgrading,theroadshallbe clearedofanysnowcover
andallowedtodrycompletely.Travelingoffthe30 footright-of-waywillnotbe allowed.
Roaddrainagecrossingsshallbe ofthetypicaldrycreekdrainagecrossingtype.
Crossingsshallbe designedsotheywillnotcausesiltationoraccumulationofdebrisin
thedrainagecrossingnorshallthedrainagesbe blockedbytheroadbed.Erosionof
drainageditchesbyrunoffwatershallbe preventedbydivertingwateroffat frequent
intervalsbymeansofcutouts.Upgradingshallnotbe allowedduringmuddyconditions.
Shouldmudholesdevelop,theyshallbe filledinanddetoursaroundthemavoided.

j. Nochemicalssubjectto reportingunderSARATitlelll inan amountequaltoorgreater
than10,000poundswillbe used,produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofannually
inassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.Furthermore,noextremelyhazardous
substances,as definedin40 CFR355, inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used,
produced,stored,transported,or disposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

k. Noroadrightofwaywillbe necessarysinceallroadsareCountyroads.Newconstuction
iswithinthe lease boundary.

3. LOCATIONOFEXISTINGWELLSWITHINA 1-MILERADIUSOFTHEPROPOSEDLOCATION.
(SeeMap"C")

a. Waterwells- none

b. Injectionwells- none

c. Producingwells- seven

d. Drillingwells- none ve,

e. Shut-inwells- three g e
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a. Waterwells- none
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f. Temporarilyabandonedwells- none

g. Disposalwells-none

h. Abandonedwells- two

i. DryHoles- none

4. LOCATIONOFTANKBATTERIESANDPRODUCTIONFAClLITIES.

a. Allpermanentstructures(onsiteforsixmonthsor longer)constructedorinstalled
(includingoilwellpumpjacks)willbe paintedCarlsbadCanyon.Allfacilitieswillbe
paintedwithinsixmonthsofinstallation.Facilitiesrequiredtocomplywiththe
OccupationalSafetyandHealthAct(OSHA)willbe excluded.

b. Ifstoragefacilities/tankbatteriesareconstructedonthislease, thefacility/batteryorthe
wellpad shallsurroundedbya containmentdikeofsufficientcapacitytocontainat a
minimum,theentirecontentsofthe largesttankwithinthefacilitylbattery,unlessmore
stringentprotectiverequirementsaredeemednecessarybytheauthorizedofficer.

c. Ifthewellis productive,a productionfacilitylayoutwillbe submittedviasundry.

d. Allloadinglineswillbe placedinsidethebermsurroundingthetankbattery.

e. Gas meterrunsforeachwellwillbe locatedwithin500feet ofthewellhead.Thegas flow
linewillbe buriedoranchoreddownfromthewellheadtotheseparator.Meterrunswill
be housedand/orfenced.

f. Theoilandgas measurementfacilitieswillbe installedonthewelllocation.The oiland
gas meterswillbe calibratedinplacepriortoanydeliveries.Tests formeteraccuracywill
be conductedmonthlyforthefirstthreemonthsonnewmeterinstallationsandat least
quarterlythereafter.TheAOwillbe providedwitha date andtimefortheinitialmeter
calibrationandallfuturemeterprovingschedules.Acopyofthemetercalibrationreports
willbe submittedtotheVernalFieldOffice.Allmetermeasurementfacilitieswillconform
withOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.4 forliquidhydrocarbonsandOnshoreOilandGas
OrderNo.5 fornaturalgas measurement.
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g. Ifat any timethefacilitieslocatedonpubliclandandauthorizedbythetermsofthelease
arenolongerincluded inthe lease (duetoa contractionintheunitorotherlease orunit
boundarychange),BLMwillprocessa changeinauthorizationtotheappropriatestatute.
Theauthorizationwillbe subjecttoappropriaterentalorotherfinancialobligationas
determinedbytheauthorizedofficer.

h. Anynecessarypitswillbe properlyfencedtopreventanywildlifeentry.

i. Allsitesecurityguidelinesidentifiedin43 CFR3162.7regulationswillbe adheredto.

j. Alloff-leasestorage,off-leasemeasurement,orcomminglingon-leaseoroff-leasewill
have priorwrittenapprovalfromtheDistrictManager.

k. Allaccessroadswillbe maintainedas necessarytopreventerosionandaccommodate
year-roundtraffic.

l. The roadwillbe maintainedina safeuseablecondition.

m. Producedwaterwillbe storedina 300bblheated, insulatedtank,thenhauledtoa
commercialdisposalsitesuchas DisposalInc.,orBrennanBottom.

n. PipelineswillfollowtherouteshownonMapD. See Pipelinedetailattached.Pipeline
ROWis requestedfortheoff-leaseportion.WearerequestingthatthisAPDbe usedas
ourROWApplication.Please notifyusoncea categorydeterminationhas been madeso
thatwecansendthenecessaryfilingfees.

5. LOCATIONANDTYPEOFWATERSUPPLY

a. The proposedwatersourcewillbe theNebeckerWaterServiceat theNebeckerWater
StationinMyton,permit#43-1721.

b. Waterwillbe hauledbyNebeckerWaterService tothelocationovertheaccessroads
shownonMapsAandB,

c. Nowaterwellwillbe drilledonthislease.

6. SOURCEOFCONSTRUCTIONMATERIAL
'y

Pe4

a. Surfaceandsubsoilmaterialsinthe immediateareawillbe utilized. &

b. Anygravelusedwillbe obtainedfroma commercialsource.
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c. The useofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformwith43 CFR3610.2.3.
Constructionmaterialwillnotbe locatedon lease.

d. Noconstructionmaterialswillbe removedfromFederalland.

7. METHODSOFHANDLINGWASTEDISPOSAL

a. The reservepitwillbe constructedso as notto leak,break,_orallowdischarge.

b. AttherequestoftheBLM,thereservepitwillbe linedwitha 12 milliner. Iffracturedrock
is encountered,thepitwillbe firstlinedwithsufficientbedding(eitherstrawordirt)to
coveranyrocks.The linerwilloverlapthepitwallsandbe coveredwithdirtand/orrocks
toholditinplace. Notrash,scrappipe,etc.,thatcouldpuncturethelinerwillbe disposed
ofinthepit. Morestringentprotectiverequirementsmaybe deemednecessarybythe
A.O.

c. Burningwillnotbe allowed.Alltrashwillbe containedina trashcageanditscontents
removedat theend ofdrillingoperationsandhauledtoanapproveddisposalsight.

d. Afterfirstproduction,producedwastewaterwillbe confinedtoa unlinedpitorstorage
tankfora periodnottoexceedninety(90)days. Duringthe90-dayperiod,inaccordance
withOnshoreOrderNo.7, anapplicationforapprovalofa permanentdisposalmethod
and location,alongwiththerequiredwateranalysis,willbe submittedfortheAO's
approval.Failuretofileanapplicationwithinthetimeallowedwillbe consideredan
incidentofnoncompliance.

e. Drillcuttingsaretobe containedandburiedinthereservepit.

f. Anysaltsand/orchemicalswhichare an integralpartofthedrillingsystemwillbe
disposedofinthesamemanneras thedrillingfluid.

g. Achemicalporta-toiletwillbe furnishedwiththedrillingrig.

h. The producedfluidswillbe producedintoa testtankuntilsuch timeas constructionof
productionfacilitiesiscompleted.Anyspillsofoil,gas saltwaterorotherproducedfluids
willbecleanedupandremoved.
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8. ANCILLARYFACILITIES

Therearenoairstrips,camps,orotherfacilitiesplannedduringthedrillingoftheproposedwell.

9. WELLSITELAYOUT

a. Thiswellwillbe locatedontheexistingpad ofthe#8-11Dwhichis currentlyshut-in.

b. Theoperatororhis/hercontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficeat 435/781-4400forty-
eight(48)hourspriortoconstructionactivities.

c. The reservepitwillbe locatedonthesouthsideofthe location.

d. Theflarepitwillbe locatedonthesouthwestsideofthereservepit, a minimumof100
feet fromthewellhead and20 feet fromthereservepitfence.

e. Thestockpiledtopsoil(firstsixinches)willbe storedonthenorthsideofthelocation,
betweencorners1 and2 nearthewellpad.Topsoilalongtheaccessroutewillbe wind
rowedontheuphillside.

f. Accesstothewellpadwillbe fromthewestas shownonthePit&Pad Layout.

g. See LocationLayoutfororientationofrig,crosssectionofdrillpad andcutsandfills.

h. The locationofmudtanks;reservepit,trashcage;piperacks;livingfacilitiesandsoil
stockpileswillbe shownontheLocationLayout.

i. Allpitswillbe fencedaccordingtothefollowingminimumstandards:

1, 39 inchnetwireshallbe usedwithat leastonestrandorbarbedwireon topof
thenetwire(barbedwireis notnecessaryifpipeorsometypeofreinforcement
rodis attachedtothetopoftheentirefence).

2. The netwireshallbe no morethan2-inchesabovetheground. The barbedwire
shallbe 3-inchesabovethenetwire.Totalheightofthefenceshallbe at least
42-inches.

PEILIIT
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3. Cornerpostsshallbe cementedand/orbracedinsucha mannerto keep the
fence tightat alltimes.

4. Standardsteel,wood,orpipeposts shallbe usedbetweenthecornerbraces.
Maximumdistancebetweenanytwopostsshallbe nogreaterthan16feet.

5. Allwireshallbe stretched,byusinga stretchingdevice,beforeitis attachedto
thecornerposts.

j. The reservepitfencingwillbe on threesides duringdrillingoperationsand onthefourth
sidewhentherigmovesoffthe location.Pitswillbe fencedandmaintaineduntilcleanup.

10. PLANSFORRESTORATIONOFSURFACE

ProducingLocation

a. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,the locationandsurroundingareawillbe clearedofall
unusedtubing,equipment,debris,materials,trashandjunknotrequiredforproduction.

b. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,anyhydrocarbonsonthepitshallbe removedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.7-1.

c. Ifa plasticnylonreinforcedlineris useditshallbe tornandperforatedbeforebackfillingof
thereservepit.

d. The reservepitand thatportionofthelocationnotneeded forproductionfacilitiesor
operationswillbe recontouredtotheapproximatenaturalcontours.The reservepitwillbe
reclaimedwithin120daysfromthedate ofwellcompletion.Beforeanydirtworktakes
place,thereservepitmusthave allfluidsandhydrocarbonsremovedandallcans,
barrels,pipe,etc.,willbe removed.

e. Reclamationofunuseddisturbedareasonthewellpad/access roadnolongerneededfor
operations,suchas cutslopes,andfillareaswillbe accomplishedbygrading,leveling
andseedingas recommendedbytheAuthorizedOfficer.Aseedmixturewillbe specified
bytheBureauofLandManagementintheirConditionsofApprovalforthesubjectwell.

Seedingwillbe performedimmediatelyafterthelocationhas been reclaimedandthepit
has been backfilled,regardlessofthetimeofyear. Seedwillbe broadcastandwalke ·

g vm
witha dozer.
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3. Cornerpostsshallbe cementedand/orbracedinsucha mannerto keep the
fence tightat alltimes.

4. Standardsteel,wood,orpipeposts shallbe usedbetweenthecornerbraces.
Maximumdistancebetweenanytwopostsshallbe nogreaterthan16feet.

5. Allwireshallbe stretched,byusinga stretchingdevice,beforeitis attachedto
thecornerposts.

j. The reservepitfencingwillbe on threesides duringdrillingoperationsand onthefourth
sidewhentherigmovesoffthe location.Pitswillbe fencedandmaintaineduntilcleanup.

10. PLANSFORRESTORATIONOFSURFACE

ProducingLocation

a. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,the locationandsurroundingareawillbe clearedofall
unusedtubing,equipment,debris,materials,trashandjunknotrequiredforproduction.

b. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,anyhydrocarbonsonthepitshallbe removedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.7-1.

c. Ifa plasticnylonreinforcedlineris useditshallbe tornandperforatedbeforebackfillingof
thereservepit.

d. The reservepitand thatportionofthelocationnotneeded forproductionfacilitiesor
operationswillbe recontouredtotheapproximatenaturalcontours.The reservepitwillbe
reclaimedwithin120daysfromthedate ofwellcompletion.Beforeanydirtworktakes
place,thereservepitmusthave allfluidsandhydrocarbonsremovedandallcans,
barrels,pipe,etc.,willbe removed.

e. Reclamationofunuseddisturbedareasonthewellpad/access roadnolongerneededfor
operations,suchas cutslopes,andfillareaswillbe accomplishedbygrading,leveling
andseedingas recommendedbytheAuthorizedOfficer.Aseedmixturewillbe specified
bytheBureauofLandManagementintheirConditionsofApprovalforthesubjectwell.

Seedingwillbe performedimmediatelyafterthelocationhas been reclaimedandthepit
has been backfilled,regardlessofthetimeofyear. Seedwillbe broadcastandwalke ·
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f. Thetopsoilstockpilewillbe seededas soonas the locationhas been constructedwiththe
samerecommendedseedmix.Theseedwillbe walkedinwitha cat.

g. The BLMhas requestedthefollowingseed mix:

Species #/s PLS/Acre

Galletta 6

WesternWheatgrass 6

Total 12

DryHole

h. Atsuchtimeas thewellis pluggedandabandoned,theoperatorshallsubmita
subsequentreportofabandonmentandBLMwillattachtheappropriatesurface
rehabilitationconditionsofapproval.

InterimSurfaceReclamationwillbe as follows:

1. Immediatelyafterfinalwellcompletion,the locationandsurroundingareawillbe cleared
ofallunusedtubing,materials,trash,anddebrisnotrequiredforproductionoperations.

2. Beforeanydirt workassociatedwithlocationrestorationtakesplace,thereservepitshall
be as dryas possible. Alldebrisinthereservepitwillbe removed.Otherwasteandspoil
materialswillbe disposedofimmediately,weatherpermitting,uponfinalwellcompletion.

3. Ifa synthetic,nylonre-enforced,lineris used, theexcesslinerwillbe cutoffand removed
andtheremaininglinerwillbe tornandperforatedwhilebackfillingthereservepit.
Alternatively,thepitwillbe pumpeddry,thelinerfoldedintothepit,andthepitbackfilled.
The linerwillbe buriedtoa minimumoffour(4)feet deep.

4. The reservepitwillbe reclaimedwithin180daysfromthedate offinalwellcompletion,
weatherpermitting.

5. The reservepitandthatportionofthelocationnotneededforproductionandstorage
facilities,andeverydayproductionoperations,willbe reshapedtotheapproximateoriginal
contourstotheextentpossible. Thiswillbe completedbybackfillingandcrowningthepit
topreventwaterfromstanding.Topsoilwillbe re-spreaduptotheriganchorpoints,

PElk
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topreventwaterfromstanding. Topsoilwillbe re-spreaduptotheriganchorpoints,
excludingtheareaneeded forproductionandstoragefacilitiesandeverydayproduction
operations.Re-seeding,usingappropriatereclamationmethods,willoccurimmediately
followingthe re-spreadingoftopsoil,weatherpermitting.TheAuthorizedOfficerwill
providea seedmixtureto re-vegetatethereservepitandotherunuseddisturbedareasat
thetimeoftheonsite.

11. SURFACEOWNERSHIP

AccessRoads - ThemajorityoftheaccessroadsaremaintainedbytheCountyRoadDepartment
ortheBureauofLandManagement.

Wellpad - Thewellpad is locatedon landsmanagedbytheBLM.

12. OTHERINFORMATION

a. AClassIllarcheologicalsurveywillbe conductedbyGrandRiverInstitute.Acopyofthis
reportwillbe submittedtotheappropriateagenciesdirectlybyGrandRiver.

b. ApaleontologyevaluationwasconductedbyAldenHamblinandis attached.Nofossils
werefoundandno mitigationis recommended.

c. ASpecialStatus PlantSpeciesReporthas been preparedbyShawnChildsofSWCA.
Mitigationrecommendationsare included.Seeattachedreport.

d. Theoperatoris responsibleforinformingallpersonsintheareaswhoareassociatedwith
thisprojectthattheywillbe subjecttoprosecutionforknowinglydisturbinghistoricor
archaeologicalsites,orforcollectingartifacts.Ifhistoricorarchaeologicalmaterialsare
uncoveredduringconstruction,theoperatoris to immediatelystopworkthatmightfurther
disturbsuchmaterials,andcontacttheauthorizedofficer(AO).Withinfiveworkingdays
theAOwillinformtheoperatoras to:

-whether thematerialsappeareligiblefortheNationalRegisterofHistoricPlaces;

-the mitigationmeasurestheoperatorwilllikelyhave to undertakebeforethesitecanbe
used (assuminginsitupreservationis notnecessary);and
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-a timeframefortheAOtocompleteandexpeditedreviewunder36 CFR800.11to
confirm,throughtheState HistoricPreservationOfficer,thatthefindingsoftheAOare
correctandthatmitigationis appropriate.Iftheoperatorwishes,at anytime,torelocate
activitiestoavoidtheexpenseofmitigationand/orthedelaysassociatedwiththis
process,theAOwillassumeresponsibilityforwhateverrecordationandstabilizationof
theexposedmaterialsmaybe required.Otherwise,theoperatorwillbe responsiblefor
mitigationcosts.TheAOwillprovidetechnicalandproceduralguidelinesfortheconduct
ofmitigation.UponverificationfromtheAOthatrequiredmitigationhas been completed,
theoperatorwillthenbeallowedtoresumeconstruction.

d. Theoperatorwillcontrolnoxiousweedsalongrights-of-wayforroads,pipelines,wellsites,
orotherapplicablefacilities.Alistofnoxiousweeds maybe obtainedfromtheBLM,or
theappropriateCountyExtensionOffice.OnBLMadministeredlanditis requiredthata
PesticideUse Proposalshallbe submitted,andgivenapproval,priortotheapplicationof
herbicidesorotherpesticidesor possiblehazardouschemicals.

e. Drillingrigsand/orequipmentusedduringdrillingoperationsonthiswellsitewillnotbe
stackedorstoredonFederalLandsaftertheconclusionofdrillingoperationsorat any
othertimewithoutBLMauthorization.However,ifBLMauthorizationis obtained,it isonly
a temporarymeasure.

f. Alllease and/orunitoperationswillbe conductedinsucha mannerthatfullcomplianceis
madewithallapplicablelaws,regulations,OnshoreOilandGasOrders,theapproved
planofoperations,andanyapplicableNoticeto Lessees. Theoperatoris fully
responsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe
furnishedthefieldrepresentativeto insurecompliance.

g. AcompletecopyoftheapprovedAPDshallbe on locationduringconstructionofthe
locationanddrillingactivities.

h. There willbe no deviationfromtheproposeddrillingand/orworkoverprogramwithout
priorapprovalfromtheAO. Safe drillingandoperatingpracticesmustbe observed.All
wells,whetherdrilling,producing,suspendedorabandonedwillbe identifiedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.

i. "SundryNoticeandReportonWells"(Form3160-5)willbe filedforapprovalforall
changesofplansandotheroperationsinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.3-2.
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j. Thispermitwillbe validfora periodofoneyearfromthedate ofapproval.Anextension
periodmaybe granted,ifrequested,priortotheexpirationoftheoriginalapprovalperiod.
Afterpermittermination,a newapplicationwillbe filedforapprovalforanyfuture
operations.

k. TheoperatororhiscontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficesat 435/781-4400 48 hours
priortoconstructionactivities.

l. The BLMOfficeshallbe notifieduponsitecompletionpriorto movingonthedrillingrig.

13. LESSEE'SOROPERATOR'SREPRESENTATIVEANDCERTIFICATION

PermitMatters Drillinq&CompletionMatters

PERMITCOINC. Gasco Production Company
14421CountyRoad10 8 InvernessDriveEast,Suite100
Ft.Lupton,CO80621 Englewood,CO80112
303/857-9999(0) John Longwell
303/857-0577(F) 303/483-0044(0)
LisaSmith 303/483-0011(F)

ShawnElworthy- FieldSuperintendent
Roosevelt,UT
435-823-4272(cell)
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CERTIFICATION

IherebycertifythatI,orpersonsundermydirectsupervision,have inspectedtheproposeddrill
siteandaccessroute;thatIamfamiliarwiththeconditionswhichpresentlyexist;thatthe
statementsmadeinthisplanare,tothebest ofmyknowledge,trueandcorrect;and,thatthe
workassociatedwiththeoperationsproposedhereinwillbe performedbyGasco Production
Companyanditscontractorsandsubcontractorsinconformitywiththeplanandthetermsand
conditionsunderwhichitisapproved.

Thisstatementis subjecttotheprovisionsof18.U.S.C.1001forthefilingofa falsestatement.

Alllease and/orunitoperationswillbe conductedinsucha mannerthatfullcomplianceis made
withallapplicablelaws,regulations,OnshoreOilandGas Orders,theapprovedplanof
operations,andanyapplicableNoticetoLessees. Theoperatorisfullyresponsibleforthe
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AcompletecopyoftheapprovedAPDandROWgrant,ifapplicable,shallbe on locationduring
constructionofthelocationanddrillingactivities.

Theoperatororhis/hercontractorshallcontacttheBLMofficeat435/781-4400forty-eight(48)
hourspriortoconstructionactivities.

The BLMOfficeshallbe notifieduponsitecompletionpriortomovingonthedrillingrig.

July28, 2006 ( L k ,

Date: TabathaParker- PERMITCOINC.
AuthorizedAgentfor:
GascoProductionCompany
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O O
PIPELINEINFORMATION

UtelandFederal #42-11-10-18

1. Thetypeofpipelineis a singlewellflowline.

2. Theoutsidediameter(O.D.)ofallwillbe 8 inchesmaximum.

3. Theanticipatedproductionthroughthelineis approximately2000 MCFper day.

4. Theanticipatedmaximumtestpressure is 1000psi.

5. Theanticipatedoperatingpressureis 100-200psi.

6. The typeofpipeis steel.

7. Themethodofcouplingiswelded.

8. Thepipelinewillbe laidon surfacebecause ofthe rockysoil.

9. Therearenootherpipelinestobe associatedinsamerightofway.

10. Therewillbe otherobjectstobe associatedin thesamerightofway. (Risers,Pig LaunchersPig
Traps,metersandotherappurtenancesas required.)

11. The totallengthofpipelineis approximately11,700feet - see MapD. ROWhas been appliedfor
acrosstheportionlocatedonState Lands.

12. The linewillbe laidonsurfacetominimizedisturbancedue torockyconditions,as shownonMapD.
Wherepossible,thepipelinewillfollowexistingorproposedroads.

13. Theconstructionwidthfortotalsurfacedisturbingactivitiesis 30 feet.

14. Theestimatedtotalacreageinvolvingallsurfacedisturbingactivitiesis 8.05acres.

15. Anysurfacedisturbancecreatedas a resultofthepipelineconstructionwillbe reclaimedutilizingthe
reclamationproceduresandseedmixturespecifiedbytheBureauofLandManagement.

16. The linewillbe testedwithgaspressureto 1000psi.
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GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

UTELAND FEDERAL #42-11-10-18
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 11, T10S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHEASTERLY
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UTELAND FEDERAL #42-11-10-18
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TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR

UTELAND FEDERAL #42-11-10-18 ×-section
SECTION 11, T10S, R18E, S.L.B.&M. scale

1591' FNL 314' FEL
,, ,1 = 50

DATE: 04-19-06
120' 110' Drawn By P.M.

Preconstruction
Grade STA. J+80

10 75' 45' 110'

LOCA T/ON STAKE

10 75' 45' 110

Slope= 1 1772: 1

SR 0+55

130' 110

/LL
Finished Grade

STA. 0+00

* NO TE'
F/LL QUANT/TY /NCLUDES

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES 5X FOR COMPACT/ON

CUT
EXCESS MATERIAL = 16,690 Cu. Yds.(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,280 Cu. Yds.

(New Construction Only) Topsoil & Pit Backfill = J,140 Cu. Yds.
Rernaining Location = 18,730 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)

EXCESS UNBALANCE = 13,550 Cu. Yds.
TOTAL CUT = 20,010 CU.YDS. (After interirn Rehabilitation)

FILL = 3,320 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. 200 Ensi * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (801)
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Archeoloqy

AClass IllArcheologicalSurveyhas been conductedbyGrandRiverInstitute.Acopyofthisreportwillbe
submittedtotheappropriateagenciesdirectlybyGrandRiverInstitute.

Paleontology
Apaleontologicalevaluationhas beenconductedbeAldenHamblin.Nofossilswerefoundandnomitigation

is recommended.

Special Status Species
ASpecialStatus PlantSpecies reporthas been preparedbyShawnChildsofSWCA.Mitigationforthesite

has been recommended.See reportattached.

0 O

Archeoloqy

AClass IllArcheologicalSurveyhas been conductedbyGrandRiverInstitute.Acopyofthisreportwillbe
submittedtotheappropriateagenciesdirectlybyGrandRiverInstitute.

Paleontology
Apaleontologicalevaluationhas beenconductedbeAldenHamblin.Nofossilswerefoundandnomitigation

is recommended.

Special Status Species
ASpecialStatus PlantSpecies reporthas been preparedbyShawnChildsofSWCA.Mitigationforthesite

has been recommended.See reportattached.

0 O

Archeoloqy

AClass IllArcheologicalSurveyhas been conductedbyGrandRiverInstitute.Acopyofthisreportwillbe
submittedtotheappropriateagenciesdirectlybyGrandRiverInstitute.

Paleontology
Apaleontologicalevaluationhas beenconductedbeAldenHamblin.Nofossilswerefoundandnomitigation

is recommended.

Special Status Species
ASpecialStatus PlantSpecies reporthas been preparedbyShawnChildsofSWCA.Mitigationforthesite

has been recommended.See reportattached.



O O
PALEONTOLOGY EVALUATION SHEET

PROJECT: (30) GASCO ENERGY Well - Uteland Federal #42-11-10-18 (existing well
location 8-11D)

LOCATION: Twenty three miles south, southeast of Roosevelt, Utah in NW¼ NE¼ section 11,
T10S, R 18 E, Uinta County, Utah

OWNERSHIP: PRIV[ ] STATE[ ] BLM[X] USFS[] NPS[ ] IND[ ] MIL[] OTHER[]

DATE: April 28, 2006

GEOLOGY/TOPOGRAPHY: This well is on an existing well location, 8-11D. Rock exposures
in the area are the lower part of the lowermember of the Uinta Formation, Upper Eocene age. The
area is rather rugged with some steep slopes in the canyon of Four Mile Wash.

PALEONTOLOGY SURVEY: YES [ ] NO Survey [ X ] PARTIAL Survey [ ]

SURVEY RESULTS: Invertebrate [ ] Plant [ ] Vertebrate [ ] Trace [ ] No Fossils Found [ X ]

PALEONTOLOGY SENSITIVITY: HIGH [ ] MEDIUM [ ] LOW [ X ] (PROJECT SPECIFIC)

MITGATION RECOMMENDATIONS: NONE [ X ] OTHER [ ] ($EE BELOW)

There is always some potential for discovery of significant paleontological resources in the Uinta
Formation. If significant vertebrate fossils (mammals, crocodiles, complete turtle shells, etc.) are
encountered during construction, work should stop in that area and a paleontologist contacted to
evaluate the material discovered.

EVALUATION BY PALEONTOLOGIST: Alden H. Hamblin
A.H. Hamblin Paleontological Consulting, 3793 N. Minersville Highway. Cedar City, Utah 84720 (435) 867-8355
Utah State Paleontological Permit # 04-339, BLM paleontological Resources Permit # UT-S-05-02.
Utah Professional Geologist License -

O O
PALEONTOLOGY EVALUATION SHEET

PROJECT: (30) GASCO ENERGY Well - Uteland Federal #42-11-10-18 (existing well
location 8-11D)

LOCATION: Twenty three miles south, southeast of Roosevelt, Utah in NW¼ NE¼ section 11,
T10S, R 18 E, Uinta County, Utah

OWNERSHIP: PRIV[ ] STATE[ ] BLM[X] USFS[] NPS[ ] IND[ ] MIL[] OTHER[]

DATE: April 28, 2006

GEOLOGY/TOPOGRAPHY: This well is on an existing well location, 8-11D. Rock exposures
in the area are the lower part of the lowermember of the Uinta Formation, Upper Eocene age. The
area is rather rugged with some steep slopes in the canyon of Four Mile Wash.

PALEONTOLOGY SURVEY: YES [ ] NO Survey [ X ] PARTIAL Survey [ ]

SURVEY RESULTS: Invertebrate [ ] Plant [ ] Vertebrate [ ] Trace [ ] No Fossils Found [ X ]

PALEONTOLOGY SENSITIVITY: HIGH [ ] MEDIUM [ ] LOW [ X ] (PROJECT SPECIFIC)

MITGATION RECOMMENDATIONS: NONE [ X ] OTHER [ ] ($EE BELOW)

There is always some potential for discovery of significant paleontological resources in the Uinta
Formation. If significant vertebrate fossils (mammals, crocodiles, complete turtle shells, etc.) are
encountered during construction, work should stop in that area and a paleontologist contacted to
evaluate the material discovered.

EVALUATION BY PALEONTOLOGIST: Alden H. Hamblin
A.H. Hamblin Paleontological Consulting, 3793 N. Minersville Highway. Cedar City, Utah 84720 (435) 867-8355
Utah State Paleontological Permit # 04-339, BLM paleontological Resources Permit # UT-S-05-02.
Utah Professional Geologist License -

O O
PALEONTOLOGY EVALUATION SHEET

PROJECT: (30) GASCO ENERGY Well - Uteland Federal #42-11-10-18 (existing well
location 8-11D)

LOCATION: Twenty three miles south, southeast of Roosevelt, Utah in NW¼ NE¼ section 11,
T10S, R 18 E, Uinta County, Utah

OWNERSHIP: PRIV[ ] STATE[ ] BLM[X] USFS[] NPS[ ] IND[ ] MIL[] OTHER[]

DATE: April 28, 2006

GEOLOGY/TOPOGRAPHY: This well is on an existing well location, 8-11D. Rock exposures
in the area are the lower part of the lowermember of the Uinta Formation, Upper Eocene age. The
area is rather rugged with some steep slopes in the canyon of Four Mile Wash.

PALEONTOLOGY SURVEY: YES [ ] NO Survey [ X ] PARTIAL Survey [ ]

SURVEY RESULTS: Invertebrate [ ] Plant [ ] Vertebrate [ ] Trace [ ] No Fossils Found [ X ]

PALEONTOLOGY SENSITIVITY: HIGH [ ] MEDIUM [ ] LOW [ X ] (PROJECT SPECIFIC)

MITGATION RECOMMENDATIONS: NONE [ X ] OTHER [ ] ($EE BELOW)

There is always some potential for discovery of significant paleontological resources in the Uinta
Formation. If significant vertebrate fossils (mammals, crocodiles, complete turtle shells, etc.) are
encountered during construction, work should stop in that area and a paleontologist contacted to
evaluate the material discovered.

EVALUATION BY PALEONTOLOGIST: Alden H. Hamblin
A.H. Hamblin Paleontological Consulting, 3793 N. Minersville Highway. Cedar City, Utah 84720 (435) 867-8355
Utah State Paleontological Permit # 04-339, BLM paleontological Resources Permit # UT-S-05-02.
Utah Professional Geologist License -



O O

SPECIAL STATUS PLANT SPECIES REPORT

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
WELL LOCATION, ACCESS ROAD, PIPELINE

Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18

PROPOSED PROJECT:

Gasco proposes to drill proposed well 42 in Section 11, Township 10 South and Range 18
East, in Uintah County, Utah. Approximately 200 feet of new road would be constructed
to access the proposed well. If the well goes into production, approximately 200 feet of
gas lines would be laid along the proposed access road. If dry, the well would be plugged
and abandoned as per BLM and State of Utah requirements.

SITE DISCRIPTION:

The proposed project is underlain by sedimentary deposits of the Uinta Formation of Late
Middle Eocene age at approximately 5,000 feet in elevation. The vegetation in the project
area is a desert shrub community consisting of shadscale saltbush, winterfat, Mormon tea,
Gardner's saltbush, mat saltbush, four-winged saltbush, rabbitbrush, and greasewood.
The understory is sparse and includes Indian ricegrass, galleta, scarlet globemallow, bud
sagebrush, spring parsley, and textile onion. Halogeton can be found in small amounts
within the native vegetation. Several species of invasive and non-native plants (Russian
thistle, cheatgrass and halogeton) occur within the project area. For a complete list of
common plants associated with the desert shrub community in the project area see
Appendix B.

Soils along the proposed access road, pipeline, and at the well location are primarily
sandy clay loam with surface rocks. Ephemeral drainages and hilly terrain characterize
the general topography.

SURVEY METHODOLOGY:

The U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service list of threatened and endangered species for Uintah
County, past survey reports and environmental documents, existing soils data, geology,
elevations, and vegetation types were reviewed to determine which federally listed
threatened, endangered and candidate plant species, and Utah/BLM sensitive species
have the potential to occur in the project area. In-house Geographic Information System
layers were examined for known locations of and suitable habitat for special status plant
species within the project area. The Uinta Basin hookless cactus (Sclerocactus glaucus) is
the only special status plant species that has potential to occur in the project area
(Appendix
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Qualifiedbiologists conducted a survey for the presencelabsence of Uinta Basin hookless
cactus at the proposed well location, access road, and pipeline on April 19, 2006. The
proposed well location, access road and pipeline were walked at 5-foot intervals to detect
the presencelabsence of this species.

Conclusion

Approximately 5 percent of suitable habitat for the Uinta Basin hookless cactus occurs at
the well location. Habitat is typical for that of the Uintah Basin hookless cactus, sandy
loam soils with surface rocks on river terraces of Fourmile Wash.

Many live individual cacti are located around the margin of the proposed well location.
These individuals are located approximately 40-feet frorn the edge of the proposed well
location.

DETERMINATIONS AND RECOMMENDATIONS:

BLM, U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service, Gasco, SWCA, and Uintah Engineering and Land
Survey conducted an on-site inspection of this well on Monday June 26, 2006. Larry
England and Bekee Megown with the U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service agreed to allow
construction of the well location under the condition that fencing be installed adjacent to
the location of known individual cacti in order to prevent direct impacts and to minimize
impacts to individuals from dust generated during construction of the well pad.

Based on a review of existing data, the results of the site-specific inventory, and input
received from the U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service, it is my professional opinion that
construction of the proposed well site, and associated access road and pipeline may affect
but is not likely to adversely affect the Uinta Basin hookless cactus.

Shawn Childs Date
Project
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Appendix A - Special Sta us Plant Species
Species Status Habitat Potential for and/or

Occurrence
Arabis vivariensis Sensitive Webber Formation sandstone None - No suitable habitat.Park rock cress and hmestone outcrops m Formations and associatedmixed desert shrub and

.
soils do not occur in thepinyon-juniper communities. project area.5000-6000ft.

Astragalus equisolensis Candidate Duchesne River Formation None - No suitable habitat.Horseshoe milkvetch soils in sagebrush, shadscale, Formations and associatedhorse brush and mixed desert soils do not occur in theshrub communities.4790-
5185ft. project area.

Astragalus hamiltonii Sensitive Duchesne, Mowery shale' None - No suitable habitat.Hamilton milkvetch Dakota and Wasatch Formations and associatedFormation soils in pinyon-
.

soils do not occur in thejuniperand desert shrub project area,communities. 5240-5800ft
Cirsium ownbeyi Sensitive East flank Uinta Mountains. None - No suitable habitat.Ownbey thistle Sagebrush, juniperand Formations and associatedriparian communities. 5500-

soils do not occur in the6200ft. project area. Out of range.
Habenaria zothecina Sensitive Moist stream banks, seeps' None - Soils andAlcove bog-orchard hanging gardens in mixed-

associated riparian areasdesert shrub, pinyon juniper, . .are not present in projectand oak brush (4,360-8,690
areas.feet).

Hymenoxyslapidicola Sensitive Rock crevices in pinyon-
None - No suitable habitat.Rock hymenoxis juniper.Uintah County Formations and associatedendemic (6,000-8,000 feet), soils do not occur in the
project area.

Lepidium huberi Sensitive Rock crevices, eroding parent None - No suitable habitat.Huber's pepperplant material and alluvial soils of Formations and associatedthe Moenkopi, Navajo, Chinle soils do not occur in theand Formations in the Uintah project area.and Green River Formation in
the Bookcliffs. 5600- 8000 ft.

Penstemon acaulis Sensitive Daggett County. Semi-barren None - No suitable habitat.
stemless penstemon substrates in pinyon-juniper Formations and associated

and sagebrush-grass soils do not occur in the
communities. 5840-7285 ft. project area.

Penstemon gibbensii Sensitive Brown's Park in Daggett None - None - No suitable
Gibbens penstemon County. Sandy and shale habitat. Formations and

(Green River Shale) bluffs associated soils do not
and slopes with juniper, occur in the project area.
thistle, Eriogonum, Elymus, Out of Range.
serviceberry, rabbit brush & ·

Thermopsis 5500-6400
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Appendix A - Special Sta us Plant Species
Species Status Habitat Potential for and/or

Occurrence
Penstemon goodrichii Sensitive Lapoint-Tridell-Whiterocks None - No suitable habitat.
Goodrich penstemon area. Duchesne River Formations and associated

Formation on blue gray to soils do not occur in the
reddish bands of clay project area,
badlands. Elevations 5590 to
6215 ft.

Penstemon grahamii Candidate East Duchesne and Uintah None - No suitable habitat.
Graham beardtongue Counties. Evacuation Creek Formations and associated

and Lower Parachute Member soils do not occur in the
of the Green River Formation. project area.
Shale knolls in sparsely
vegetated desert shrub and
pinyon-juniper communities.
4600-6700 ft

Penstemon scariosus var. Candidate Evacuation Creek and Lower None - No suitable habitat.
albifluvis Parachute Creek Member of Formations and associated
White River penstemon the Green River Formation on soils do not occur in the

sparsely vegetated shale project area.
slopes in mixed desert shrub
and pinyon-juniper
communities. 5000-6000ft

Schoencrambe argillacea Threatened Bookcliffs On the contact None - No suitable habitat.
Clay thelopody zone between the upper Uinta Formations and associated

and lower Green River shale soils do not occur in the
formations in mixed desert project area.
shrub of Indian ricegrass and
pygmy sagebrush.5000-5650
ft.

Schoencrambe suffrutescens Endangered Evacuation Creek and lower None - No suitable habitat.
Shrubby reed-mustard Parachute Creek Members of Formations and associated

the Green River Formation on soils do not occur in the
calcareous shale in pygmy project area.
sagebrush, mountain
mahogany, juniperand mixed
desert shrub communities.
5400-6000ft.

Sclerocactus glaucus Threatened Gravelly hills and terraces on Yes - Suitable habitat for
(Sclerocactus brevispinus) Quaternaryand tertiary this species occurs in the
Uinta Basin hookless cactus alluvium soils in cold desert . project area.

shrub communities. 4700- ¯
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Appendix A - Special Status Plant Species

Species Status Habitat Potential for and/or
Occurrence

Spiranthes diluvialis Threatened Streams, bogs and open None - Soils and
Ute lady's tresses seepages in cottonwood, salt associated riparian areas

cedar, willow and pinyon- are not present in project
junipercommunities on the areas.
south and east slope of the
Uintah Range and it's
tributaries, and the Green
River from Browns Park to
Split mountain. Potentially in
the Upper reaches of streams
in the Book Cliffs. 4400-
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Appendix B - Common Plants in the Desert Shrub Community in the Project Area.

Scientific Name Common Name

Shrubs

Atnplex canescens Four-winged saltbush

Atnþlex confernfolia Shad scale

Atnplex corrugata Mat saltbush

Atuple×gardneri Gardner's saltbush

Artemisia spinescens Bud sage

Ceratoideslanata Winterfat

Chrysothamnusspp. Rabbitbrush species

Ephedra nevadensis Mormon tea

Sartabatusvermiculatus Greasewood

Tetradymiaspinosa Horsebrush

Grasses and Forbs

Agropyrondarystachyumvar. dasystachyum Thickspike wheatgrass

Allium textile Textile onion

Arenana spp. Sandwort

Cleomelutea Yellow beeplant
Cymoptemsspp. Spring parsley
Enogonuminflatum Desert trumpet

Descurainiapinnata Tansy mustard
Hilariajamesii Galleta

PhaceRacresulata Scorpionweed
Phlo× spp. Phlox

Sitanionhystnx Squitreltail

3phaera/ceaspp. Globemallow

Sporobolusairoides Alkali sacaton

Stzpahymenoides Indian ricegrass

Plant names are using Utah Flora
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GASCO
Energy

Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office
170 S. 500 E.
Vernal, UT 84078

Atin: Minerals

Re: AllW lis
Uintah County, L)tah

Gentlemen:

This letter is to inform you that Permitco Inc. is authorizedto act as Agent and to sign

documents on behalf of Gasco Production Company, a wholly owned subsidiaryof Gasco

Energy, Inc. When necessary for filing county, state and federal permits including Onshore

Order No. 1, Right ofWay applications,etc., for the above mentionedwell.

It should be understood that Permitco is acting as Agent only in those matters stated

above and is not responsible for drilling, completion, production or compliance with

regulations.

Gasco Production Company agrees to acceptfullresponsibilityfor operations conductedin

order to drill, complete and produce the above-mentioned well..

!ÁÍsrk1 Choury
Land Manager //

GLSD0Energy, Inc.
14 invainoss Drive East. Suite H-236 Tel: (303) 483-0044 Email: invest©gaseaenergy.com

à ¿lescod, CO 801124625 Esx; 1303)483-0011 Website: www.gascoenergy.com OTCOB.
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WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 11/30/2006 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-38896

WELL NAME: UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18

OPERATOR: GASCO PRODUCTION ( N2575 ) PHONE NUMBER: 303-857-9999

CONTACT: VENESSA LANGMACHER

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SENE 11 1005 180E Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 1591 FNL 0314 FEL

BOTTOM: 1591 FNL 0314 FEL Engineering

COUNTY: UINTAH Geology
LATITUDE: 39.96126 LONGITUDE: -109.8517

UTM SURF EASTINGS:598077 NORTHINGS:4423878 Surface

FIELD NAME: UTELAND BUTTE ( 695 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-013429 PROPOSED FORMATION: BLKHK

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

// Plat R649-2-3.

p/" Bond: Fed [1] Ind [] Sta [] Fee [] Unit:
(No. UT-1233 )

Al Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

AA Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:46o From otr/otr a 920' netween wells

Water Permit %/ R649-3-3. Exception
050.43-1721 )

Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N)

(Date: ) Board Cause No:
Eff Date:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

\ B Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:
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0
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah November 30, 2006

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
E.recudveDirector Gasco Production Company

8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Division of Englewood, CO 80112

Oil, Gas & Mining
JOHN R. BAZA
Division oirec'"' Re: Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18 Well, 1591' FNL, 314' FEL, SE NE, Sec. 11,

T. 10 South, R. 18 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative
approval of the requested exception location is hereby granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-38896.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor (via e-mail)
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (80 I) 359-3940 • TTY (80!) 538-7458 •
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Operator: Gasco Production Company
Well Name & Number Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18

API Number: 43-047-38896
Lease: UTU-Ol3429

Location: SE NE Sec. 11 T. 10 South R. 18 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the
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u3..Tss, RECElVED 37NoARR

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR JUL3 120U 5. Lease Serial No.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-013429A

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe NameAPPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER N/A
la. Type of Work: DRILL REENTER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name andNo.

N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.

b. Type of Well: OH Well Gas Well Other Single Zone Multiple Zone Uteland Federal #42-11-10-18
2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044 8 InvernessDriveEast, Suite 100 9. API Well No.

Gasco Production Company Englewood,CO80112
3. Name of Agent 303-857-9999 14421County Road 10 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

Permitco Inc.- Agent FortLupton,CO80621 Riverbend
4. Location ofWell (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area

At surface 1591'FNLand314' FEL Section 11,T10S-R18E
At proposed prod. zone SENE
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately27.2milessoutheastof Myton,UT Uintah UT
IS. Utstancetrotnproposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit i edicated to this welllocation to nearest

pedy or lease line, R 314'o nearest drig. umt line, if any) --4920-0 40 Acres; SE NE
18. Distancefrom proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on fileto nearest well, drilling, completed, Approx.75'applied for, on this lease, ft. 12,325'(ShutIn) Bond #UT-1233

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration
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UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: Gasco Production Co. Location: SENE, Sec 11, T10S, R18E
Well No: Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18 Lease No: UTU-013429A
API No: 43-047-38896 Agreement: N/A

Title Name Office Phone Number Cell Phone Number
Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker (435) 781-4490 (435) 828-4470
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee (435) 781-4432 (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer: James Ashley (435) 781-4470 (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer: Ryan Angus (435) 781-4430 (435) 828-7368
Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger (435) 781-4502 (435) 828-3913
NRSÆnviro Scientist: Paul Buhler (435) 781-4475 (435) 828-4029
NRSÆnviro Scientist: Karl Wright (435) 781-4484
NRSÆnviro Scientist: Holly Villa (435) 781-4404
NRSÆnviro Scientist: Chuck MacDonald (435) 781-4441 (435) 828-7481
NRSÆnviro Scientist: Jannice Cutler (435) 781-3400
NRSÆnviro Scientist: Michael Cutler (435) 781-3401
NRSÆnviro Scientist: Anna Figueroa (435) 781-3407
NRSÆnviro Scientist: Verlyn Pindell (435) 781-3402
NRS/Enviro Scientist: Darren Williams (435) 781-4447
NRSÆnviro Scientist: Nathan Packer (435) 781-3405

Fax: (435) 78 1-4410
A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR

FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE
All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with the
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill including
Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion
operations. This permit is approved for a two (2) year period, or until lease expiration, whichever occurs
first. An additional extension, up to two (2) years, may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and
(Notify Environmental Scientist) access roads.
Location Completion - Prior to moving on the drilling rig.
(Notify Environmental Scientist)
Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notify Petroleum Engineer)
Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and cementing
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.)_ all casing strings.
BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
(Notify Supv. Petroleum Tech.)
First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify Petroleum Engineer) production resumes after well has been off production for more

than ninety (90)
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Well: Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

GENERAL SURFACE COA

• If there is an active Gilsonite mining operation within 2 miles of the well location, operator shall
notify the Gilsonite operator at least 48 hours prior to any blasting during construction.

• If paleontological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately
stop work and contact the Authorized Officer (AO). A report will be prepared by a BLM
permitted paleontologist and submitted to the AO at the completion of surface disturbing
activities.

SITE SPECIFIC COAs

• Surface Conditions of Approval or monitoring are listed in the Surface Use Plan of the APD.

• Due to the presence of individual Uintah Basin hookless cactus around the margin of the well pad, the
operator shall construct and install adequate fencing adjacent to the location of known individual cacti in
order to prevent direct impacts and to minimize impacts to individuals from dust generated during
construction of the well pad. The protective fence shall be six feet in height, utilize silt containment
material such as burlap or other similar material, and be placed an appropriate distance from the cactus as
to not impede sunlight.

• In addition, occupied Uinta Basin hookless cactus habitats within 100' of the edge of the surface
pipelines' right-of-ways, 100' of the edge of the roads' right-of-ways, and 100' from the edge of the well
pad shall be monitored for a period of three years after ground disturbing activities. Monitoring will
include annual plant surveys to determine plant and habitat impacts relative to project facilities. Annual
reports shall be provided to the BLM and the Service. To ensure desired results are being achieved,
minimization measures will be evaluated and may be changed after a thorough review of the monitoring
results and annual reports during annual meetings between the BLM and the Service.

• The operator shall install a double layer of felt under the standard 12mm reserve pit liner in order to
mitigate any potential impact to T&E Fish.

• Within 90 calendar days of the approval date for this Application for Permit to Drill (APD), the
operator/lessee shall submit to the Authorized Officer (AO), on Sundry Notice Form 3160-5, an Interim
Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on well pads, access roads, and pipelines. At a
minimum, this will include the reshaping of the pad to the original contour to the extent possible; the re-

spreading of the top soil up to the rig anchor points; and, the area reseeded using appropriate reclamation
methods. The AO will provide written approval or concurrence within 30 calendar days of receipt. The
following seed mix shall be used:

Type lbs./acre
Western Wheatgrass Agropyron smithii 4
Needle and Threadgrass Stipa comata 4
Hy-crest Crested wheatgrass Agropyron cristatum 4
** Seed shall be drilled; but if broadcasted double the pounds per acre used
and work the solids mechanically to cover the
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• Following well plugging and abandonment, the location, access roads, pipelines, and other facilities shall
be reclaimed. All disturbed surfaces shall be reshaped to approximate the original contour; the top soil
re-spread over the surface; and, the surface re-vegetated. The surface of approved staging areas where
construction activities did not occur may require disking or ripping and reseeding. The following seed
mix shall be used, unless BLM personnel determine that conditions have changed and another mix would
be more suitable:

Type lbslacre
Shadscale Atriplex confertifolia 3
Gardner saltbush Atriplex nuttallii 3
Hy-crest Crested wheatgrass Agropyron cristatum 3
Indian Rice Grass Oryzopsis hymenoides 3
** Seed shall be drilled; but if broadcasted double the pounds per acre used
and work the solids mechanically to cover the
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DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

• Electronic/mechanincal mud monitoring equipment shall be required, from intermediate 8 5/8
.

inch casing shoe to TD, which shall include as a minimum: pit volume totalizer (PVT), stroke
counter, and flow sensor.

All provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

DRILLINGICOMPLETION/PRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

• The spud date and time shall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding.

• Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least 24 hours in
advance of casing cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure tests.

• Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use until the well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times.
Choke manifolds shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

• All BOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the
daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil & Gas
Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be
performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and NOT by the rig pumps. Test shall be
reported in the driller's log.

• BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from
under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

• Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and
cemented in place.

• No aggressive/fresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

• Cement baskets shall not be run on surface casing.

• The operator must report all shows of water or water-bearing sands to the BLM. If flowing
water is encountered it must be sampled, analyzed, and a copy of the analyses submitted to the
BLM Vernal Field Office.

• The operator must report encounters of all non oil & gas mineral resources (such as Gilsonite, tar
sands, oil shale, trona, etc.) to the Vernal Field Office, in writing, within 5 working days of each
encounter. Each report shall include the well namelnumber, well location, date and depth (from
KB or GL) of encounter, vertical footage of the encounter and, the name of the person
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the report (along with a telephone number) should the BLM need to obtain additional
information.

• A complete set of angular deviation and directional surveys of a directional well will be
submitted to the Vernal BLM office engineer within 30 days of the completion of the well.

• Chronologic drilling progress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM, Vernal Field Office
on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers until the well is
completed.

• A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the top of cement and
shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of
the CBL to this office.

• Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

• There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as
approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Any changes in operation
must have prior approval from the BLM Vernal Field
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OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

• All wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

• In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "Monthly Report of
Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which
operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and
abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management
Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-
3650 for reporting information.

• Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLM Vernal Field office must be
notified when it is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be by written
communication and must be received in this office by not later than the fifth business day
following the date on which the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a
minimum, the following informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephone number.

o Well name and number.

o Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royalty will
be paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise the
non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.

• All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will
be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A, shall be
reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than
Major Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on
the Monthly Report of Operations and

COAs: Page 6 of 8
Well: Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18

OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

• All wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

• In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "Monthly Report of
Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which
operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and
abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management
Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-
3650 for reporting information.

• Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLM Vernal Field office must be
notified when it is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be by written
communication and must be received in this office by not later than the fifth business day
following the date on which the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a
minimum, the following informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephone number.

o Well name and number.

o Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royalty will
be paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise the
non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.

• All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will
be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A, shall be
reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than
Major Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on
the Monthly Report of Operations and

COAs: Page 6 of 8
Well: Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18

OPERATING REQUIREMENT REMINDERS:

• All wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well.

• In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "Monthly Report of
Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which
operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and
abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management
Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-
3650 for reporting information.

• Should the well be successfully completed for production, the BLM Vernal Field office must be
notified when it is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be by written
communication and must be received in this office by not later than the fifth business day
following the date on which the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a
minimum, the following informational items:

o Operator name, address, and telephone number.

o Well name and number.

o Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

o Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which royalty will
be paid).

o The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head gas, or
natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located; otherwise the
non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

o Unit agreement and/or participating area name and number, if applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.

• All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will
be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events, as defined in NTL3A, shall be
reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than
Major Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on
the Monthly Report of Operations and



COAs: Page 7 of 8
Well: Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18

• Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days
after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys or
data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be
filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well completion report a geologic report including,
at a minimum, formation tops, and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys,
sample descriptions, strip logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if
performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the
BLM, Vernal Field Office.

• All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease, shall have
prior written approval from the BLM Vernal Field Office.

• Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The BLM Vernal Field
Office Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be
submitted to the BLM Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the API
standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement. All
measurement points shall be identified as the point of sale or allocation for royalty purposes.

• A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted
to the BLM Vernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever
occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively
sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3.

• Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including roads, gathering
lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall require the filing of
a suitable plan and need prior approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office. Emergency approval
may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report requirement.

• No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30
days, prior approval of the BLM Vernal Field Office shall be obtained and notification given
before resumption of operations.

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but no
later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not been
approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-day period will be considered as an Incident of
Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this
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• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or
abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent
Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual
plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of
casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface
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COEllUlAl
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GASAND MINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-013429

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 NDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells, signilicantlydeepen existin0 wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to NAdrill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1 TYPE OF WELL 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9 API NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4304738896

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 Englewood Co 80112 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1591' FNL & 314' FEL COUNTY: Uintah

QTR ITR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENE 11 10S 18E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O BUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Ori0inal Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME} WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Extend Permit
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinentdelais including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Gasco Production Company would like to request a one year extension on this APD from the date it is due to expire (11/30/07)

Approved by the
Utah Divisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) verly Walker TITLE Engineering Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 10/24/2007

(TMs space for Stale use only)

RECEIVED
OCT3 1 2007

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

gly.OFOIL,GAS&
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SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 NDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drill new wells, signilicantlydeepen existin0 wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to NAdrill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1 TYPE OF WELL 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9 API NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company 4304738896

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr E, Ste 100 Englewood Co 80112 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1591' FNL & 314' FEL COUNTY: Uintah

QTR ITR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENE 11 10S 18E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O BUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Ori0inal Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME} WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Extend Permit
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinentdelais including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Gasco Production Company would like to request a one year extension on this APD from the date it is due to expire (11/30/07)

Approved by the
Utah Divisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) verly Walker TITLE Engineering Technician

SIGNATURE DATE 10/24/2007

(TMs space for Stale use only)

RECEIVED
OCT3 1 2007

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

gly.OFOIL,GAS&
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gly.OFOIL,GAS&



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 4304738896
Well Name: Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18

Location: SENE Section ll-Tl0S-RISE

Company Permit issued to: Gasco Production Company
Date Original Permit Issued: 11/30/2006

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drillon the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application,which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONolZI

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO NolZI

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesO NolZl

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesO No IZI

Has the approved source ofwater for drillingchanged? YesO NolZI

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation?YesO No1ZI

Is bonding still in plaæ, which covers this proposed well? Yes1ZINoO

10/24/2007

gnature Date

Title: Engineering Technician

Representing: Gasco Production Company

RECEIVED

OCT3 1 2007

Div.0FOIL,GAS&

Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)
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The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drillon the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill, remains valid and does not require revision.
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10/24/2007

gnature Date

Title: Engineering Technician

Representing: Gasco Production Company

RECEIVED

OCT3 1 2007

Div.0FOIL,GAS&

Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)
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gnature Date
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Representing: Gasco Production Company
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OCT3 1 2007

Div.0FOIL,GAS&



RPR 16 2000 1:31PM HP LASERJET 3200 P.2

STATEOF UTAN FoRM 6DEPARTMENT OËNATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GASAND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Gasco Production Co Operator Account Number: N 2575
Address: 8 inverness DriveEast, Ste 100

city Englewood

9tyte Co zip 80112 Phone Number. (303) 483-0044

Well i
APl#Iamber Name See TWP Utng Comt
4304738896 Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18 SENE 11 108 18E Uintah

Action Code currentEmilly elålvmHHy Spud Date Entity AsolgamelkRumber umber ERecHvoOdie

·ãr i il BIAL
w.

APINumber lÃÑl iÍ9 4 0

Action Code currentRn bygnlity pad Date Entay Aaalgnment
Numboy winber ENeedve Date

Comments:

INumber lMiiß 9

Acuen Coda denentgggy 3|às Engly SpudOefe EMityAssignmentlhamber Nunibit

Comments:

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Beve Walker
B - Add new well toexistingentity (grouporunit well) Na e Print)
C - Reassign well from one existing entity to another existing entity ; / ( y 4D - Re-assign well fromone existing entity to a new entity nature '
E - Other(Explain in 'comments'section) RECEIVE insering rechnician 4/16/2008

Title Dale
.2.o APR16 2008

DN.0FOlL,GAS&
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.2.o APR16 2008

DN.0FOlL,GAS&
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DN.0FOlL,GAS&



vormaiso-s UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-Ol37

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMEÑÏ Expires: March 31, 2007

Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to driH or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned wen. Use Form 316 3 (APD) for such proposals. N A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructíons on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

I. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Foorage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) Uteland Butte

1591' FNL & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec I1-T10S-R18E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPOR T, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production ( Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integnty

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Spud Well

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations(clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated staiting date of any proposed work and approximate dumtion thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed withm 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved opemtions. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been cornpleted, and the opemtor has
determined that the site isready for final inspection.

This well was spud on 3/30/2008.

RECEIVED
APR22 2008

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed? Typed)

Beverly WalþýÎ Engineering Technician

Signatur Date

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page

vormaiso-s UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-Ol37

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMEÑÏ Expires: March 31, 2007
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APR22 2008

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed? Typed)

Beverly WalþýÎ Engineering Technician

Signatur Date

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page
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If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed withm 30 days
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APR22 2008

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING
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Beverly WalþýÎ Engineering Technician
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THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page



Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR o -

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expir 1

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Uteland Butte
1591' FNL & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec l l-TIOS-RI8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRJATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

otice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Status Sundly

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all peitinuit markers and zones.
Attach the Bond unde which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(M shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all raiuirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site isready for fmalinspection.

This well was spud on 3/30/2008.
We expect to resume drilling operations by the 4th quarter of 2008.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Beverly Wallgrr Engineering Technician

Signat e Date
June 3, 2008

/ THISMACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to m et r agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

Og OFO\LGAS

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR o -

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expir 1

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
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1. Type of Well NA
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4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Uteland Butte
1591' FNL & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec l l-TIOS-RI8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRJATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

otice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Status Sundly

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all peitinuit markers and zones.
Attach the Bond unde which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(M shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all raiuirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site isready for fmalinspection.

This well was spud on 3/30/2008.
We expect to resume drilling operations by the 4th quarter of 2008.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Beverly Wallgrr Engineering Technician

Signat e Date
June 3, 2008

/ THISMACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to m et r agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

Og OFO\LGAS

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR o -

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expir 1

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Uteland Butte
1591' FNL & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec l l-TIOS-RI8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRJATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

otice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Status Sundly

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all peitinuit markers and zones.
Attach the Bond unde which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(M shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all raiuirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site isready for fmalinspection.

This well was spud on 3/30/2008.
We expect to resume drilling operations by the 4th quarter of 2008.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Beverly Wallgrr Engineering Technician

Signat e Date
June 3, 2008

/ THISMACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to m et r agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

Og OFO\LGAS



vonnaiso-s UNITED STATES FORM ARROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 10040137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expire March31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use tiris form for proposals to driß or to re-enter an 6. If indian, Allottee, or TribeName
abandoned weU. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well

Oil well Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Nameof Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API WeHNo.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, &c.. E. R.. M., or Surver Descnpilog Wildcat

1591' FNL & 314' FEL i t. County or Parish, state
SENEofSec1l-T10S-RI8E Uintah,UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production(Start/ Resume) Water Shut-ofT

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperations(clearlystate all pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting date of anyproposedmerk and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete florizontally,give subsurfacelocationsand measuredand true veltical depthsof all pertinot markers and zones.Attach the Bond unde which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 3160-4shall be filedoncetesting has been completed. FinalAbandonment Notices shallbe filed only afta all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdetermined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This well is currentiv permitted to 12,325
Gasco Production Co would like to attempt to complete this well within the Mancos at 14,303 Approvedby the
The maximum anticipated mud weight will be I1.5# gallon WahDivisionof
The only change to the casing design will be the additional footageof4-l/2" 15.I#/ft P-I10 Oil,Gas and Mining
LT&C casing.
The cement design has been revised to accommodate the additional well depih. AdditionaHy
the cement system to be used has been revised as follows:
523 sacks of 35:65 Por "G" I I.S PPG, 3.05 yield
/650 sacAs50:50 Por "G", /4./ PPG, Yield =1.28 cu.fi/sk
This cement design should result in a cement top at 2500' If hole conditions indicate, the number
of sacks of cement will be increased to achieve a calcidated cement top of2500'. Final top of
cement will be verified by CBL
Gasco will be instaHing a 3rd ram on the BOP stack

_ .. Ogggig
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed 7pped)
Title

Beverly Wylker Engineering Technician
Signature I Date

i O C r ( June 5, 2008
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATEOFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant oi
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crirne for any person knowingly and willfully to make any nited
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.
a-,-'

JUNOS2008

niv.0F01, MS &

vonnaiso-s UNITED STATES FORM ARROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 10040137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expire March31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use tiris form for proposals to driß or to re-enter an 6. If indian, Allottee, or TribeName
abandoned weU. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well

Oil well Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Nameof Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API WeHNo.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, &c.. E. R.. M., or Surver Descnpilog Wildcat

1591' FNL & 314' FEL i t. County or Parish, state
SENEofSec1l-T10S-RI8E Uintah,UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production(Start/ Resume) Water Shut-ofT

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperations(clearlystate all pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting date of anyproposedmerk and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete florizontally,give subsurfacelocationsand measuredand true veltical depthsof all pertinot markers and zones.Attach the Bond unde which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 3160-4shall be filedoncetesting has been completed. FinalAbandonment Notices shallbe filed only afta all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdetermined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This well is currentiv permitted to 12,325
Gasco Production Co would like to attempt to complete this well within the Mancos at 14,303 Approvedby the
The maximum anticipated mud weight will be I1.5# gallon WahDivisionof
The only change to the casing design will be the additional footageof4-l/2" 15.I#/ft P-I10 Oil,Gas and Mining
LT&C casing.
The cement design has been revised to accommodate the additional well depih. AdditionaHy
the cement system to be used has been revised as follows:
523 sacks of 35:65 Por "G" I I.S PPG, 3.05 yield
/650 sacAs50:50 Por "G", /4./ PPG, Yield =1.28 cu.fi/sk
This cement design should result in a cement top at 2500' If hole conditions indicate, the number
of sacks of cement will be increased to achieve a calcidated cement top of2500'. Final top of
cement will be verified by CBL
Gasco will be instaHing a 3rd ram on the BOP stack

_ .. Ogggig
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed 7pped)
Title

Beverly Wylker Engineering Technician
Signature I Date

i O C r ( June 5, 2008
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATEOFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant oi
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crirne for any person knowingly and willfully to make any nited
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.
a-,-'

JUNOS2008

niv.0F01, MS &

vonnaiso-s UNITED STATES FORM ARROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 10040137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expire March31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use tiris form for proposals to driß or to re-enter an 6. If indian, Allottee, or TribeName
abandoned weU. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well

Oil well Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Nameof Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API WeHNo.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, &c.. E. R.. M., or Surver Descnpilog Wildcat

1591' FNL & 314' FEL i t. County or Parish, state
SENEofSec1l-T10S-RI8E Uintah,UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production(Start/ Resume) Water Shut-ofT

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperations(clearlystate all pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting date of anyproposedmerk and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete florizontally,give subsurfacelocationsand measuredand true veltical depthsof all pertinot markers and zones.Attach the Bond unde which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 3160-4shall be filedoncetesting has been completed. FinalAbandonment Notices shallbe filed only afta all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdetermined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This well is currentiv permitted to 12,325
Gasco Production Co would like to attempt to complete this well within the Mancos at 14,303 Approvedby the
The maximum anticipated mud weight will be I1.5# gallon WahDivisionof
The only change to the casing design will be the additional footageof4-l/2" 15.I#/ft P-I10 Oil,Gas and Mining
LT&C casing.
The cement design has been revised to accommodate the additional well depih. AdditionaHy
the cement system to be used has been revised as follows:
523 sacks of 35:65 Por "G" I I.S PPG, 3.05 yield
/650 sacAs50:50 Por "G", /4./ PPG, Yield =1.28 cu.fi/sk
This cement design should result in a cement top at 2500' If hole conditions indicate, the number
of sacks of cement will be increased to achieve a calcidated cement top of2500'. Final top of
cement will be verified by CBL
Gasco will be instaHing a 3rd ram on the BOP stack

_ .. Ogggig
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed 7pped)
Title

Beverly Wylker Engineering Technician
Signature I Date

i O C r ( June 5, 2008
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATEOFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant oi
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crirne for any person knowingly and willfully to make any nited
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.
a-,-'

JUNOS2008

niv.0F01, MS &



ronn3;oo-s UNITED STATES ? FORMAPPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR I OMB No. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5 Lease'Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 1]TU-013429

Do not use th¡s form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 316 3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
I. TypeofWell NA

Oil wen Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Foorage, Sec., 7, R., M , or Survey Description) Utel and Butte

1591' FNL & 3 l 4' FEL 11 County or Parish, State
SE NE of Sec ll-Tl0S-Rl8E Uintah, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRlATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Alteting Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

SubsequentReport Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Keep data

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon confidential

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deependirotionallyor recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond unde which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afta all raiuirements, including reclamation, have beei completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

Gasco Production Company will be moving a rig onto ihis location to start drilling within
the next fewweeks we respectfully request that you keep all records confidential for as long

of'a period as possible.

RECEIVED
JUNi 3 2008

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Prmted Typed)

Title
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

signature Date
June 1, 2008

I THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page

ronn3;oo-s UNITED STATES ? FORMAPPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR I OMB No. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5 Lease'Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 1]TU-013429

Do not use th¡s form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 316 3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
I. TypeofWell NA

Oil wen Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Foorage, Sec., 7, R., M , or Survey Description) Utel and Butte

1591' FNL & 3 l 4' FEL 11 County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec ll-Tl0S-Rl8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRlATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Alteting Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

SubsequentReport Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Keep data

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon confidential

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deependirotionallyor recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond unde which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afta all raiuirements, including reclamation, have beei completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

Gasco Production Company will be moving a rig onto ihis location to start drilling within
the next fewweeks we respectfully request that you keep all records confidential for as long

of'a period as possible.

RECEIVED
JUNi 3 2008

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Prmted Typed)

Title
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

signature Date
June 1, 2008

I THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page

ronn3;oo-s UNITED STATES ? FORMAPPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR I OMB No. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5 Lease'Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 1]TU-013429

Do not use th¡s form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 316 3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
I. TypeofWell NA

Oil wen Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Foorage, Sec., 7, R., M , or Survey Description) Utel and Butte

1591' FNL & 3 l 4' FEL 11 County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec ll-Tl0S-Rl8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRlATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Alteting Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

SubsequentReport Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Keep data

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon confidential

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deependirotionallyor recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond unde which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afta all raiuirements, including reclamation, have beei completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

Gasco Production Company will be moving a rig onto ihis location to start drilling within
the next fewweeks we respectfully request that you keep all records confidential for as long

of'a period as possible.

RECEIVED
JUNi 3 2008

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Prmted Typed)

Title
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

signature Date
June 1, 2008

I THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page



O
Form 3160- s UNITED STATES i O FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March3],2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0 I3429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6. lf Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 316 3 (APD) for such proposais. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operatos Uteland Federal 42-l 1-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 | 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea
4. Location of Well (Foologe. Sec., T

.
R. M . or Survey Description) Ute land Butte

1591' FNL & 3 14' FEL l 1. County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec l l-T10S-Rl8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPOR f, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production ( Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon Change conductor depth

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinot markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsa¡uent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all ra¡uirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

Our original permit stated that we would set 200' of 13-3/8" H-40 48# conductor pipe. Gasco
Production Company would like to change this to 40' of 13-3/8" H-40 48# conductor pipe. The
pipe would be cemented using 50 sx of Premium 7ppe 5 15.6 ppg l.18 yield Gasco will be
installing a diverter forwell control in the event ofshallow gas or water shows.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR RECElVED
oat.Je2(o'ET JUNi 3 2008
Initials: A

DIV,OF01L,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Prmied 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

signature oate
March 29, 2008

THIS SPAÔET R FEDERAL OR STATE OFFI E USE3

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or VOL
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office 2S ActÌ0018ÑOC6SSaty
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for an lo ma artment or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter withi

(Insovertons on page

O

Form 3160- s UNITED STATES i O FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March3],2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0 I3429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6. lf Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 316 3 (APD) for such proposais. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operatos Uteland Federal 42-l 1-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 | 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea
4. Location of Well (Foologe. Sec., T

.
R. M . or Survey Description) Ute land Butte

1591' FNL & 3 14' FEL l 1. County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec l l-T10S-Rl8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPOR f, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production ( Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon Change conductor depth

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinot markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsa¡uent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all ra¡uirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

Our original permit stated that we would set 200' of 13-3/8" H-40 48# conductor pipe. Gasco
Production Company would like to change this to 40' of 13-3/8" H-40 48# conductor pipe. The
pipe would be cemented using 50 sx of Premium 7ppe 5 15.6 ppg l.18 yield Gasco will be
installing a diverter forwell control in the event ofshallow gas or water shows.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR RECElVED
oat.Je2(o'ET JUNi 3 2008
Initials: A

DIV,OF01L,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Prmied 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

signature oate
March 29, 2008

THIS SPAÔET R FEDERAL OR STATE OFFI E USE3

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or VOL
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office 2S ActÌ0018ÑOC6SSaty
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for an lo ma artment or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter withi

(Insovertons on page

O

Form 3160- s UNITED STATES i O FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March3],2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0 I3429
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Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon Change conductor depth
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13 Describe Proposed or CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinot markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsa¡uent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all ra¡uirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

Our original permit stated that we would set 200' of 13-3/8" H-40 48# conductor pipe. Gasco
Production Company would like to change this to 40' of 13-3/8" H-40 48# conductor pipe. The
pipe would be cemented using 50 sx of Premium 7ppe 5 15.6 ppg l.18 yield Gasco will be
installing a diverter forwell control in the event ofshallow gas or water shows.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR RECElVED
oat.Je2(o'ET JUNi 3 2008
Initials: A

DIV,OF01L,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Prmied 7pped)
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Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

signature oate
March 29, 2008

THIS SPAÔET R FEDERAL OR STATE OFFI E USE3

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or VOL
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office 2S ActÌ0018ÑOC6SSaty
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for an lo ma artment or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter withi

(Insovertons on page



Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANA GEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

67, peaseSerial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELÌJS UTU-0 13429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6j If indian,Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If unitor cA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M , or Survey Description) Utel and Butte
1591' FNL & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-R18E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Status Sundry

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, includingestimated starting dateof any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinait markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No, on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316¾ shall be filedonce
testinghas been completed. Final AbandonmentNotiœs shall be filed only afta all rajuirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This well was spud on 3/30/2008.
We expect to resume drilling operations by the 4th quarter of2008.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Beverly Walk Engineering Technician

Signatur Date
July 2, 2008

/ THIS SPA E FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant oi
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any depa t ed
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page " JULO7 2008

DN.0FO\L,GAS&

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANA GEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

67, peaseSerial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELÌJS UTU-0 13429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6j If indian,Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If unitor cA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M , or Survey Description) Utel and Butte
1591' FNL & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-R18E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Status Sundry

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, includingestimated starting dateof any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinait markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No, on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316¾ shall be filedonce
testinghas been completed. Final AbandonmentNotiœs shall be filed only afta all rajuirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This well was spud on 3/30/2008.
We expect to resume drilling operations by the 4th quarter of2008.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Beverly Walk Engineering Technician

Signatur Date
July 2, 2008

/ THIS SPA E FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant oi
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any depa t ed
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page " JULO7 2008
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Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANA GEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

67, peaseSerial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELÌJS UTU-0 13429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6j If indian,Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If unitor cA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M , or Survey Description) Utel and Butte
1591' FNL & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-R18E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Status Sundry

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, includingestimated starting dateof any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinait markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No, on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316¾ shall be filedonce
testinghas been completed. Final AbandonmentNotiœs shall be filed only afta all rajuirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This well was spud on 3/30/2008.
We expect to resume drilling operations by the 4th quarter of2008.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Beverly Walk Engineering Technician

Signatur Date
July 2, 2008

/ THIS SPA E FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant oi
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any depa t ed
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page " JULO7 2008

DN.0FO\L,GAS&



CONFIDENRGASCO ENERGY

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT L

nergy
AFE #60507 GPS

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/7/08 DAYS: RM 2
Current: Operations: ACCIDENT INVESTIGATION & PAPER WORK
Depth: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation:

DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $33,890 CWC: $161,710
Contracto : N/BORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PviYP: #2 Type: Int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 20,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : S/N: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 4,290
Tine Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 18:00 12 LOAD OUT RIG AND MOVE TO NEW LOCATION - 90% MOVED 50% RIGGED UP Misc.I Labor: $ 2,600

18:00 20:00 2 AFTER PINNING DERRICK TO FLOOR (2) CRANE SWAMPERS WENT TO UNHOOK CRANES csg. Crew: $ -

AT 18:15 BROCK REED A SWAPER FOR VALLEY CREST CRANE FELL 25'-30' FROM TOP OF Daily Total: $ 33,890

DERRICK INTO SUB - ALL EQUIPMENT WAS SHUT DOWN & ATHORITIES WERE CALLED Cum. Wtr: $ -

LIFE FLIGHT SHOWED UP ON LOCATION g 19:30 AND TRANSPORTED HIM TO THE UNIV. Cum. Fuel $ -

OF UTAH IN SALT LAKE CITY- INJURIESWERE; LACERATION TO HEAD, DISORIENTED, & Cum. Bits: $ -

BREATHING WAS DIFFICULT - COULD MOVE ALL EXTREMITIES BHA

20:00 21:30 2.5 SET IN LAST TRAILER - RIG UP CAMPS & SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT

21:30 6:00 7.5 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

RECEIVED
JULO72000

WùFûlL,GAS&MINING
TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BOILER 0 Survey

PIU K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

S/O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 7586 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFIDENRGASCO ENERGY

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT L

nergy
AFE #60507 GPS

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/7/08 DAYS: RM 2

Current: Operations: ACCIDENT INVESTIGATION & PAPER WORK
Depth: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation:

DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $33,890 CWC: $161,710
Contracto : N/BORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PviYP: #2 Type: Int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 20,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : S/N: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 4,290
Tine Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 18:00 12 LOAD OUT RIG AND MOVE TO NEW LOCATION - 90% MOVED 50% RIGGED UP Misc.I Labor: $ 2,600

18:00 20:00 2 AFTER PINNING DERRICK TO FLOOR (2) CRANE SWAMPERS WENT TO UNHOOK CRANES csg. Crew: $ -

AT 18:15 BROCK REED A SWAPER FOR VALLEY CREST CRANE FELL 25'-30' FROM TOP OF Daily Total: $ 33,890

DERRICK INTO SUB - ALL EQUIPMENT WAS SHUT DOWN & ATHORITIES WERE CALLED Cum. Wtr: $ -

LIFE FLIGHT SHOWED UP ON LOCATION g 19:30 AND TRANSPORTED HIM TO THE UNIV. Cum. Fuel $ -

OF UTAH IN SALT LAKE CITY- INJURIESWERE; LACERATION TO HEAD, DISORIENTED, & Cum. Bits: $ -

BREATHING WAS DIFFICULT - COULD MOVE ALL EXTREMITIES BHA

20:00 21:30 2.5 SET IN LAST TRAILER - RIG UP CAMPS & SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT

21:30 6:00 7.5 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

RECEIVED
JULO72000

WùFûlL,GAS&MINING
TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BOILER 0 Survey

PIU K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

S/O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 7586 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFIDENRGASCO ENERGY

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT L

nergy
AFE #60507 GPS

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/7/08 DAYS: RM 2

Current: Operations: ACCIDENT INVESTIGATION & PAPER WORK
Depth: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation:

DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $33,890 CWC: $161,710
Contracto : N/BORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PviYP: #2 Type: Int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 20,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : S/N: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 4,290
Tine Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 18:00 12 LOAD OUT RIG AND MOVE TO NEW LOCATION - 90% MOVED 50% RIGGED UP Misc.I Labor: $ 2,600

18:00 20:00 2 AFTER PINNING DERRICK TO FLOOR (2) CRANE SWAMPERS WENT TO UNHOOK CRANES csg. Crew: $ -

AT 18:15 BROCK REED A SWAPER FOR VALLEY CREST CRANE FELL 25'-30' FROM TOP OF Daily Total: $ 33,890

DERRICK INTO SUB - ALL EQUIPMENT WAS SHUT DOWN & ATHORITIES WERE CALLED Cum. Wtr: $ -

LIFE FLIGHT SHOWED UP ON LOCATION g 19:30 AND TRANSPORTED HIM TO THE UNIV. Cum. Fuel $ -

OF UTAH IN SALT LAKE CITY- INJURIESWERE; LACERATION TO HEAD, DISORIENTED, & Cum. Bits: $ -

BREATHING WAS DIFFICULT - COULD MOVE ALL EXTREMITIES BHA

20:00 21:30 2.5 SET IN LAST TRAILER - RIG UP CAMPS & SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT

21:30 6:00 7.5 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

RECEIVED
JULO72000

WùFûlL,GAS&MINING
TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BOILER 0 Survey

PIU K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

S/O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 7586 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP



CONFilENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY AME s

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT og - 388
nergy

AFE#60507 GPS
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/8/08 DAYS: RM 3
Current: Operations: RIGGING UP FLOOR TO P/U TOP DRIVE
Depth: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVl0! Formation:

DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $27,000 CWC: $188,710
Contractor: NP 3ORS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. FluHS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: #2 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 20,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 13:00 7 INVESTIGATE ACCIDENT & WAIT ON OSHA TO ALLOW VALLEY CREST CRANE TO WORK STATUS Misc. I Labor: $ -

13:00 21:00 8 SET A-LEGS WITH CRANE AND RELEASE CRANE - RIG UP DERRICK & STRING UP BLOCKS - RAISE Csg. Crew: $ -

DERRICK & SUB Daily Total: $ 27,000

21:00 6:00 9 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT Cum. wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

100% MOVED 70% RIGGED UP Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

RECE VED
JULO8 2008

. Ut Ù\L,WAb&MINING

TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BoiLER 0 Survey

PIU K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 7586 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC BIS G ODC RP

CONFilENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY AME s

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT og - 388
nergy

AFE#60507 GPS
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/8/08 DAYS: RM 3

Current: Operations: RIGGING UP FLOOR TO P/U TOP DRIVE
Depth: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVl0! Formation:

DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $27,000 CWC: $188,710
Contractor: NP 3ORS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. FluHS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: #2 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 20,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 13:00 7 INVESTIGATE ACCIDENT & WAIT ON OSHA TO ALLOW VALLEY CREST CRANE TO WORK STATUS Misc. I Labor: $ -

13:00 21:00 8 SET A-LEGS WITH CRANE AND RELEASE CRANE - RIG UP DERRICK & STRING UP BLOCKS - RAISE Csg. Crew: $ -

DERRICK & SUB Daily Total: $ 27,000

21:00 6:00 9 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT Cum. wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

100% MOVED 70% RIGGED UP Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

RECE VED
JULO8 2008

. Ut Ù\L,WAb&MINING

TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BoiLER 0 Survey

PIU K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 7586 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC BIS G ODC RP

CONFilENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY AME s

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT og - 388
nergy

AFE#60507 GPS
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/8/08 DAYS: RM 3

Current: Operations: RIGGING UP FLOOR TO P/U TOP DRIVE
Depth: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVl0! Formation:

DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $27,000 CWC: $188,710
Contractor: NP 3ORS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. FluHS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: #2 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 20,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 13:00 7 INVESTIGATE ACCIDENT & WAIT ON OSHA TO ALLOW VALLEY CREST CRANE TO WORK STATUS Misc. I Labor: $ -

13:00 21:00 8 SET A-LEGS WITH CRANE AND RELEASE CRANE - RIG UP DERRICK & STRING UP BLOCKS - RAISE Csg. Crew: $ -

DERRICK & SUB Daily Total: $ 27,000

21:00 6:00 9 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT Cum. wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

100% MOVED 70% RIGGED UP Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

RECE VED
JULO8 2008

. Ut Ù\L,WAb&MINING

TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BoiLER 0 Survey

PIU K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 7586 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC BIS G ODC RP



CONFIDENTRGA GASCO ENERGY '

Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3 96

RKB: 25.6'
AFE # 60507 GPS

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/9/08 DAYS: RM 4

Current: Operations: WAIT ON WELDER TO CUT CONDUCTOR
Depth: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVl0! Formation:

DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $31,070 CWC: $219,780
Contracto.: NPBORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: #2 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 20,000

Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ 3,640 Trucking: $ 430

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LTT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 10 Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ 3,640 insurance $ -

6:00 16:00 10 DOWN TIME - ALL 3 GENERATORS DOWN WAIT ON ELEC. TO FIX Misc.I Labor: $ -

16:00 17:00 1 RIG UP FLOOR TO PICK UP TOP DRIVE - BRIDAL DOWN Csg. Crew: $ -

17:00 21:00 4 PIU TOP DRIVE & SET IN PIPE SKATE - RIG UP TOP DRIVE Daily Total: $ 27,430

21:00 6:00 9 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT & WELDER TO CUT & NIPPLE UP CONDUCTOR Cum. Wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BOILER 0 Survey

P/U K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 5904 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFIDENTRGA GASCO ENERGY '

Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3 96

RKB: 25.6'
AFE # 60507 GPS

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/9/08 DAYS: RM 4

Current: Operations: WAIT ON WELDER TO CUT CONDUCTOR
Depth: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVl0! Formation:

DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $31,070 CWC: $219,780
Contracto.: NPBORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: #2 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 20,000

Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ 3,640 Trucking: $ 430

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LTT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 10 Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ 3,640 insurance $ -

6:00 16:00 10 DOWN TIME - ALL 3 GENERATORS DOWN WAIT ON ELEC. TO FIX Misc.I Labor: $ -

16:00 17:00 1 RIG UP FLOOR TO PICK UP TOP DRIVE - BRIDAL DOWN Csg. Crew: $ -

17:00 21:00 4 PIU TOP DRIVE & SET IN PIPE SKATE - RIG UP TOP DRIVE Daily Total: $ 27,430

21:00 6:00 9 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT & WELDER TO CUT & NIPPLE UP CONDUCTOR Cum. Wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BOILER 0 Survey

P/U K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 5904 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFIDENTRGA GASCO ENERGY '

Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3 96

RKB: 25.6'
AFE # 60507 GPS

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/9/08 DAYS: RM 4

Current: Operations: WAIT ON WELDER TO CUT CONDUCTOR
Depth: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVl0! Formation:

DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $31,070 CWC: $219,780
Contracto.: NPBORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: #2 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 20,000

Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ 3,640 Trucking: $ 430

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LTT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 10 Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ 3,640 insurance $ -

6:00 16:00 10 DOWN TIME - ALL 3 GENERATORS DOWN WAIT ON ELEC. TO FIX Misc.I Labor: $ -

16:00 17:00 1 RIG UP FLOOR TO PICK UP TOP DRIVE - BRIDAL DOWN Csg. Crew: $ -

17:00 21:00 4 PIU TOP DRIVE & SET IN PIPE SKATE - RIG UP TOP DRIVE Daily Total: $ 27,430

21:00 6:00 9 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT & WELDER TO CUT & NIPPLE UP CONDUCTOR Cum. Wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BOILER 0 Survey

P/U K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 5904 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT SEnergy

RKB: 25.6'
AFE # 60507 GPS

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/10/08 DAYS: 1
Current: Operations: DRILLING SURFA CE @
Deptfi: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: UINTA
DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $62,320 CWC: $282,100
Contracto : N/SORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGlBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: #2 Type: MS1677BZ Int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 23,500
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : SIN: 5134 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 400
Cake: Press: Jets: 7X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 29,910
MBT AV DP: Depth In: 84 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: 1.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: 14.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: 5 Pumping LIT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 55 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 19 Total Rot. Hrs: 1.5 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 9:00 3 RIG UP FLOOR - STAB MOUSEHOLES - CUT OFF CONDUCTOR AND WELD DRAIN VALVE Misc.I Labor: $ 1,510
9:00 12:00 3 NIU CONDUCTOR & RIG UP FLOW LINE Csg. Crew: $ -

12:00 6:00 6 TAKE EXTRA WRAPS OFF DRUM AND SPOOL UP - INSTALL NEW LOWER WELL CONTROL VALVE Daily Total: $ 62,320

6:00 3:00 9 DOWN TIME - PRESSURE TEST SURFACE EQUIPMENT - CHANGE OUT (2) HAMMER UNION Cum. Wtr: $ -

O-RINGS - TIGHTEN UP ALL HAMMER UNIONS ON STAND PIPE, CHANGE POP-OFF ON #2 Cum. Fuel $ -

PUMP, CHANGE SWAB & LINER IN #1 PUMP, HAD SOME ELEC. PROBLEMS w/#1 PUMP Cum. Bits: $ -

3:00 4:30 1.5 PIU SMALL BHA TOOLS AND GET ON FLOOR - MAKE UP BIT & MOTOR BHA
4:30 6:00 1.5 DRGL FR 84'-105' @ 14'lHR

HEt,EIVED
JUL10 2008

DIV.0E0lL,0At&MltllflG

TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BOILER 0 Survey

P/U K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

S/O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 494 On Hand: 12579 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS

BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT SEnergy

RKB: 25.6'
AFE # 60507 GPS

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/10/08 DAYS: 1
Current: Operations: DRILLING SURFA CE @
Deptfi: 60' Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: UINTA
DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $62,320 CWC: $282,100
Contracto : N/SORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGlBLE COST

MW: #1 Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: #2 Type: MS1677BZ Int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 23,500
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : SIN: 5134 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 400
Cake: Press: Jets: 7X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 29,910
MBT AV DP: Depth In: 84 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: 1.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: 14.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: 5 Pumping LIT: $ - Surface damages $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 55 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 19 Total Rot. Hrs: 1.5 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 9:00 3 RIG UP FLOOR - STAB MOUSEHOLES - CUT OFF CONDUCTOR AND WELD DRAIN VALVE Misc.I Labor: $ 1,510
9:00 12:00 3 NIU CONDUCTOR & RIG UP FLOW LINE Csg. Crew: $ -

12:00 6:00 6 TAKE EXTRA WRAPS OFF DRUM AND SPOOL UP - INSTALL NEW LOWER WELL CONTROL VALVE Daily Total: $ 62,320

6:00 3:00 9 DOWN TIME - PRESSURE TEST SURFACE EQUIPMENT - CHANGE OUT (2) HAMMER UNION Cum. Wtr: $ -

O-RINGS - TIGHTEN UP ALL HAMMER UNIONS ON STAND PIPE, CHANGE POP-OFF ON #2 Cum. Fuel $ -

PUMP, CHANGE SWAB & LINER IN #1 PUMP, HAD SOME ELEC. PROBLEMS w/#1 PUMP Cum. Bits: $ -

3:00 4:30 1.5 PIU SMALL BHA TOOLS AND GET ON FLOOR - MAKE UP BIT & MOTOR BHA

4:30 6:00 1.5 DRGL FR 84'-105' @ 14'lHR

HEt,EIVED
JUL10 2008

DIV.0E0lL,0At&MltllflG

TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 BOILER 0 Survey

P/U K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKGGAS

S/O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 494 On Hand: 12579 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS

BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP



CONFIDENR
GASCO ENERGY ~~/'/ds rf /g s-//

DAILY DRILLING REPORT Lg - OV 3$¾Ú
Energy wayo na>

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/11/08 DAYS: 2
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD @1114'
Depth: 1114' Prog: 1009 D Hrs: 18 Av RoP: 56.1 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $1,256 TMC: $1,256 TDC: $37,973 CWC: $370,673
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui1S TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 26 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Type: MS1677BZ int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : SIN: 5134 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 2,590
Cake: Press: Jets: 7X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Sollds: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: 84 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 8.3 JetVel: FTG: 1030 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: 19.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 21000 SPR #1 : FPH: 53.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 920 SPR#2: WOB: 18 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,256

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 22.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 19.5 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 9:30 3.5 DOWNTIME - CONDUCTOR BOLTSON SLIP-ON FLANGENEEDEDTIGHTENED - TURN BUCKLES TIGHTEL Misc. I Labor: $ 3,127
9:30 14:00 4.5 DRGL FR 105' -

234° @ 29'IHR Csg. Crew: $ -

14:00 15:00 1 X-O CAUGHT ON TOP SECTION OF CONDUCTOR PULLING IT OFF - RESET CONDUCTOR & CENTER UP Daily Total: $ 37,973
15:00 21:00 6 DRLG FR 234' - 545' @ 52.8'/ HR Cum. Wtr: $ -

21:00 21:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY - WAS 1/2 DEGREE Cum. Fuel $ -

21:30 22:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Cum. Bits: $ -

22:00 23:30 1.5 DRLG FR 545'- 668' @ 82'IHR BHA

23:30 0 0.5 INSTALL ROT. HEAD BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

0 6:00 6 DRLGFR668'-1114'@74'IHR MOTOR 8" 34.46

SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

D.C. 8" 29.78

IBS 12 1/8" 6.15

HECEIVED D.C. 8" 29.86

JUL1 1 2000 '"" "" °

D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O&D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 637.40

Survey 450' 1 1/2*

24.00 Survey

PIU 70 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

S/O 48 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 63 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET g 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1148 On Hand: 11431 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFIDENR
GASCO ENERGY ~~/'/ds rf /g s-//

DAILY DRILLING REPORT Lg - OV 3$¾Ú
Energy wayo na>

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/11/08 DAYS: 2

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD @1114'
Depth: 1114' Prog: 1009 D Hrs: 18 Av RoP: 56.1 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $1,256 TMC: $1,256 TDC: $37,973 CWC: $370,673
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui1S TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 26 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Type: MS1677BZ int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : SIN: 5134 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 2,590
Cake: Press: Jets: 7X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Sollds: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: 84 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 8.3 JetVel: FTG: 1030 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: 19.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 21000 SPR #1 : FPH: 53.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 920 SPR#2: WOB: 18 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,256

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 22.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 19.5 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 9:30 3.5 DOWNTIME - CONDUCTOR BOLTSON SLIP-ON FLANGENEEDEDTIGHTENED - TURN BUCKLES TIGHTEL Misc. I Labor: $ 3,127
9:30 14:00 4.5 DRGL FR 105' -

234° @ 29'IHR Csg. Crew: $ -

14:00 15:00 1 X-O CAUGHT ON TOP SECTION OF CONDUCTOR PULLING IT OFF - RESET CONDUCTOR & CENTER UP Daily Total: $ 37,973
15:00 21:00 6 DRLG FR 234' - 545' @ 52.8'/ HR Cum. Wtr: $ -

21:00 21:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY - WAS 1/2 DEGREE Cum. Fuel $ -

21:30 22:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Cum. Bits: $ -

22:00 23:30 1.5 DRLG FR 545'- 668' @ 82'IHR BHA

23:30 0 0.5 INSTALL ROT. HEAD BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

0 6:00 6 DRLGFR668'-1114'@74'IHR MOTOR 8" 34.46

SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

D.C. 8" 29.78

IBS 12 1/8" 6.15

HECEIVED D.C. 8" 29.86

JUL1 1 2000 '"" "" °

D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O&D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 637.40

Survey 450' 1 1/2*

24.00 Survey

PIU 70 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

S/O 48 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 63 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET g 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1148 On Hand: 11431 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFIDENR
GASCO ENERGY ~~/'/ds rf /g s-//

DAILY DRILLING REPORT Lg - OV 3$¾Ú
Energy wayo na>

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/11/08 DAYS: 2

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD @1114'
Depth: 1114' Prog: 1009 D Hrs: 18 Av RoP: 56.1 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $1,256 TMC: $1,256 TDC: $37,973 CWC: $370,673
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui1S TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 26 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Type: MS1677BZ int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : SIN: 5134 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 2,590
Cake: Press: Jets: 7X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Sollds: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: 84 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 8.3 JetVel: FTG: 1030 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: 19.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 21000 SPR #1 : FPH: 53.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 920 SPR#2: WOB: 18 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,256

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 22.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 19.5 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 9:30 3.5 DOWNTIME - CONDUCTOR BOLTSON SLIP-ON FLANGENEEDEDTIGHTENED - TURN BUCKLES TIGHTEL Misc. I Labor: $ 3,127
9:30 14:00 4.5 DRGL FR 105' -

234° @ 29'IHR Csg. Crew: $ -

14:00 15:00 1 X-O CAUGHT ON TOP SECTION OF CONDUCTOR PULLING IT OFF - RESET CONDUCTOR & CENTER UP Daily Total: $ 37,973
15:00 21:00 6 DRLG FR 234' - 545' @ 52.8'/ HR Cum. Wtr: $ -

21:00 21:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY - WAS 1/2 DEGREE Cum. Fuel $ -

21:30 22:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Cum. Bits: $ -

22:00 23:30 1.5 DRLG FR 545'- 668' @ 82'IHR BHA

23:30 0 0.5 INSTALL ROT. HEAD BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

0 6:00 6 DRLGFR668'-1114'@74'IHR MOTOR 8" 34.46

SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

D.C. 8" 29.78

IBS 12 1/8" 6.15

HECEIVED D.C. 8" 29.86

JUL1 1 2000 '"" "" °

D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O&D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 637.40

Survey 450' 1 1/2*

24.00 Survey

PIU 70 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

S/O 48 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 63 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET g 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1148 On Hand: 11431 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP



CONFIDENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY /03 R/4f s-//

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT L 3-0 - 3¶$$†(,
Energy swo

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/14/08 DAYS: 5
Current: Operations: TROUBLE SHOOTING MWD TOOLS TO GET SURVEY
Depth: 1000' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: UINTA
DMC: $552 TMC: $6,056 TDC: $31,552 CWC: $495,441
Contracto : Nf BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flui JS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 27 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ Int.csg: $ - DayRate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : S/N: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 10.3 JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 60 SPR#2: WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 552
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 22.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 40.0 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 20:00 14 WAIT ON CEMENT Misc. I Labor: $ -

20:00 22:30 2.5 PIU DIR. TOOLS & ORIENT Csg. Crew: $ -

22:30 23:00 0.5 T.I.H. TO 700' TEST SHOT MWD TOOLS Daily Total: $ 31,552
23:00 0 1 TROUBLE SHOOT MWD TOOLS - PUMP READING IS INCORRECT- CHANCE OUT TRANSDUCER, Cum. Wtr: $ -

ALL CABLES, & CHECK ALL SURFACE EQUIPMENT - STILL NOT WORKING Cum. Fuel $ -

0 1:00 1 T.I.H. & TAG CEMENT @950' DRILL CMT FR 950' -1000' -CEMENT STARTED GETTING HARDER NEAR 100 Cum. Bits: $ -

1:00 2:00 1 T.O.O.H. FOR MWD TOOLS - NEED TO REPROGRAM MWD TOOL BHA

2:00 4:30 2.5 REPROGRAM MWD TOOL - TROUBLESHOOT PROBLEM - CHANGE OUT MAIN LINE TO DRILLERS BOX BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

4:30 5:00 0.5 T.I.H. TO 920' - INSTALL ROT. HEAD MOTOR 8" 34.46

5:00 6:00 1 TROUBLE SHOOT MWD TOOLS - CHANGE OUT PRESSURE SETTING OF TRANSDUCER - STILL NOT SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

PUMPING UP CORRECT SURVEYS MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

IBS 12 1/8" 6.15

RECEIVED D.C. 8" 29.86

IBS 12 1/8" 5.90

JUL1 4 2008 D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O & D.C. 6" 463.53

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING TOTAL BHA = 640.76

Survey

24.00 Survey

PIU 0 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. O K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET g 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 738 On Hand: 7302 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# 1 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 3 WT G X IN CT

CONFIDENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY /03 R/4f s-//

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT L 3-0 - 3¶$$†(,
Energy swo

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/14/08 DAYS: 5
Current: Operations: TROUBLE SHOOTING MWD TOOLS TO GET SURVEY
Depth: 1000' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: UINTA
DMC: $552 TMC: $6,056 TDC: $31,552 CWC: $495,441
Contracto : Nf BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flui JS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 27 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ Int.csg: $ - DayRate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : S/N: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 10.3 JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 60 SPR#2: WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 552
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 22.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 40.0 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 20:00 14 WAIT ON CEMENT Misc. I Labor: $ -

20:00 22:30 2.5 PIU DIR. TOOLS & ORIENT Csg. Crew: $ -

22:30 23:00 0.5 T.I.H. TO 700' TEST SHOT MWD TOOLS Daily Total: $ 31,552
23:00 0 1 TROUBLE SHOOT MWD TOOLS - PUMP READING IS INCORRECT- CHANCE OUT TRANSDUCER, Cum. Wtr: $ -

ALL CABLES, & CHECK ALL SURFACE EQUIPMENT - STILL NOT WORKING Cum. Fuel $ -

0 1:00 1 T.I.H. & TAG CEMENT @950' DRILL CMT FR 950' -1000' -CEMENT STARTED GETTING HARDER NEAR 100 Cum. Bits: $ -

1:00 2:00 1 T.O.O.H. FOR MWD TOOLS - NEED TO REPROGRAM MWD TOOL BHA

2:00 4:30 2.5 REPROGRAM MWD TOOL - TROUBLESHOOT PROBLEM - CHANGE OUT MAIN LINE TO DRILLERS BOX BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

4:30 5:00 0.5 T.I.H. TO 920' - INSTALL ROT. HEAD MOTOR 8" 34.46

5:00 6:00 1 TROUBLE SHOOT MWD TOOLS - CHANGE OUT PRESSURE SETTING OF TRANSDUCER - STILL NOT SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

PUMPING UP CORRECT SURVEYS MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

IBS 12 1/8" 6.15

RECEIVED D.C. 8" 29.86

IBS 12 1/8" 5.90

JUL1 4 2008 D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O & D.C. 6" 463.53

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING TOTAL BHA = 640.76

Survey

24.00 Survey

PIU 0 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. O K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET g 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 738 On Hand: 7302 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# 1 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 3 WT G X IN CT

CONFIDENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY /03 R/4f s-//

DAILY DRILLINGREPORT L 3-0 - 3¶$$†(,
Energy swo

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/14/08 DAYS: 5
Current: Operations: TROUBLE SHOOTING MWD TOOLS TO GET SURVEY
Depth: 1000' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: UINTA
DMC: $552 TMC: $6,056 TDC: $31,552 CWC: $495,441
Contracto : Nf BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flui JS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 27 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ Int.csg: $ - DayRate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : S/N: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 10.3 JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 60 SPR#2: WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 552
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 22.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 40.0 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 20:00 14 WAIT ON CEMENT Misc. I Labor: $ -

20:00 22:30 2.5 PIU DIR. TOOLS & ORIENT Csg. Crew: $ -

22:30 23:00 0.5 T.I.H. TO 700' TEST SHOT MWD TOOLS Daily Total: $ 31,552
23:00 0 1 TROUBLE SHOOT MWD TOOLS - PUMP READING IS INCORRECT- CHANCE OUT TRANSDUCER, Cum. Wtr: $ -

ALL CABLES, & CHECK ALL SURFACE EQUIPMENT - STILL NOT WORKING Cum. Fuel $ -

0 1:00 1 T.I.H. & TAG CEMENT @950' DRILL CMT FR 950' -1000' -CEMENT STARTED GETTING HARDER NEAR 100 Cum. Bits: $ -

1:00 2:00 1 T.O.O.H. FOR MWD TOOLS - NEED TO REPROGRAM MWD TOOL BHA

2:00 4:30 2.5 REPROGRAM MWD TOOL - TROUBLESHOOT PROBLEM - CHANGE OUT MAIN LINE TO DRILLERS BOX BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

4:30 5:00 0.5 T.I.H. TO 920' - INSTALL ROT. HEAD MOTOR 8" 34.46

5:00 6:00 1 TROUBLE SHOOT MWD TOOLS - CHANGE OUT PRESSURE SETTING OF TRANSDUCER - STILL NOT SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

PUMPING UP CORRECT SURVEYS MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

IBS 12 1/8" 6.15

RECEIVED D.C. 8" 29.86

IBS 12 1/8" 5.90

JUL1 4 2008 D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O & D.C. 6" 463.53

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING TOTAL BHA = 640.76

Survey

24.00 Survey

PIU 0 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. O K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET g 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 738 On Hand: 7302 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# 1 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 3 WT G X IN CT



CONFilENGL
GASCO ENERGY -7~¡¾ R igts-i(

DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/3dyy-37 9 GEnergy oren a
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/15/08 DAYS: 6

Current: Operations: SLIDING 80% FOR&lATION
Depth: 1651' Prog: 651 D Hrs: 20 AV ROP: 32.6 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $387 TMC: $6,443 TDC: $64,132 CWC: $559,546
Contracto : NP BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. FlUIIS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 27 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : S/N: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 31,245
MBT AV DP: Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 12.2 Jetvel: FTo: 702 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2.10/3.00 ECD: Hrs: 20 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 35.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

ca : 640 SPR#2: WOB: TIME DRILL Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 387

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: 0 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 22.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 60.0 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 8:00 2 TROUBLE SHOOT MWD TOOLS - RIG POWER WAS SURGING TO MUCH GIVING TOOLS INCORRECT Misc. I Labor: $ -

READINGS - HOOKED MWD TOOLS INTO GENERATOR & STARTED WORKING CORRECTLY Csg. Crew: $ -

8:00 14:00 6 DRILL FR 1000' - 1396' @66'IHR SURVEY EVERY 90 Daily Total: $ 64,132

14:00 15:30 1.5 SLIDE FR 1396°-1480' @ 56'IHR HAD 30% FORMATION COMING OVER SHAKER THAN CAME BACK TO Cum. Wtr: $ -

100% CEMENT COMING OVER SHAKERS - Cum. Fuel $ -

15:30 16:00 RIGSERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Cum. Bits: $ -

16:00 6:00 14 SLIDE FR 1480'-1651' @12'IHR 80% FORMATION COMING OVER SHAKERS BHA

BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

MOTOR 8" 34.46

RECElVED SHOCKSUB 8" 8.50

MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

JUL 2008 IBS 121/8" 6.15

D.C. 8" 29.86

DIMOFOIL,GAS&MINING iss 12 9,8- s.so

D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O & D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 640.76

NOTE: ADDED SURVEY SHEET TO DRILLING REPORT Survey

24.00 Survey

P/U 109 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO 98 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 110 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 2079 On Hand: 12190 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# 1 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 3 WT G X IN CT

CONFilENGL
GASCO ENERGY -7~¡¾ R igts-i(

DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/3dyy-37 9 GEnergy oren a
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/15/08 DAYS: 6

Current: Operations: SLIDING 80% FOR&lATION
Depth: 1651' Prog: 651 D Hrs: 20 AV ROP: 32.6 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $387 TMC: $6,443 TDC: $64,132 CWC: $559,546
Contracto : NP BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. FlUIIS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 27 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : S/N: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 31,245
MBT AV DP: Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 12.2 Jetvel: FTo: 702 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2.10/3.00 ECD: Hrs: 20 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 35.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

ca : 640 SPR#2: WOB: TIME DRILL Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 387

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: 0 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 22.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 60.0 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 8:00 2 TROUBLE SHOOT MWD TOOLS - RIG POWER WAS SURGING TO MUCH GIVING TOOLS INCORRECT Misc. I Labor: $ -

READINGS - HOOKED MWD TOOLS INTO GENERATOR & STARTED WORKING CORRECTLY Csg. Crew: $ -

8:00 14:00 6 DRILL FR 1000' - 1396' @66'IHR SURVEY EVERY 90 Daily Total: $ 64,132

14:00 15:30 1.5 SLIDE FR 1396°-1480' @ 56'IHR HAD 30% FORMATION COMING OVER SHAKER THAN CAME BACK TO Cum. Wtr: $ -

100% CEMENT COMING OVER SHAKERS - Cum. Fuel $ -

15:30 16:00 RIGSERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Cum. Bits: $ -

16:00 6:00 14 SLIDE FR 1480'-1651' @12'IHR 80% FORMATION COMING OVER SHAKERS BHA

BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

MOTOR 8" 34.46

RECElVED SHOCKSUB 8" 8.50

MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

JUL 2008 IBS 121/8" 6.15

D.C. 8" 29.86

DIMOFOIL,GAS&MINING iss 12 9,8- s.so

D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O & D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 640.76

NOTE: ADDED SURVEY SHEET TO DRILLING REPORT Survey

24.00 Survey

P/U 109 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO 98 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 110 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 2079 On Hand: 12190 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# 1 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 3 WT G X IN CT

CONFilENGL
GASCO ENERGY -7~¡¾ R igts-i(

DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/3dyy-37 9 GEnergy oren a
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/15/08 DAYS: 6

Current: Operations: SLIDING 80% FOR&lATION
Depth: 1651' Prog: 651 D Hrs: 20 AV ROP: 32.6 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $387 TMC: $6,443 TDC: $64,132 CWC: $559,546
Contracto : NP BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. FlUIIS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 27 SPM: Size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: GPM : S/N: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 31,245
MBT AV DP: Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 12.2 Jetvel: FTo: 702 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2.10/3.00 ECD: Hrs: 20 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 35.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

ca : 640 SPR#2: WOB: TIME DRILL Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 387

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: 0 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 22.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 60.0 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 8:00 2 TROUBLE SHOOT MWD TOOLS - RIG POWER WAS SURGING TO MUCH GIVING TOOLS INCORRECT Misc. I Labor: $ -

READINGS - HOOKED MWD TOOLS INTO GENERATOR & STARTED WORKING CORRECTLY Csg. Crew: $ -

8:00 14:00 6 DRILL FR 1000' - 1396' @66'IHR SURVEY EVERY 90 Daily Total: $ 64,132

14:00 15:30 1.5 SLIDE FR 1396°-1480' @ 56'IHR HAD 30% FORMATION COMING OVER SHAKER THAN CAME BACK TO Cum. Wtr: $ -

100% CEMENT COMING OVER SHAKERS - Cum. Fuel $ -

15:30 16:00 RIGSERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Cum. Bits: $ -

16:00 6:00 14 SLIDE FR 1480'-1651' @12'IHR 80% FORMATION COMING OVER SHAKERS BHA

BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

MOTOR 8" 34.46

RECElVED SHOCKSUB 8" 8.50

MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

JUL 2008 IBS 121/8" 6.15

D.C. 8" 29.86

DIMOFOIL,GAS&MINING iss 12 9,8- s.so

D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O & D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 640.76

NOTE: ADDED SURVEY SHEET TO DRILLING REPORT Survey

24.00 Survey

P/U 109 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO 98 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 110 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 2079 On Hand: 12190 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# 1 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 3 WT G X IN CT



CONFIDEGASCO ENERGY

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/s-oV'? 3 S

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/16/08 DAYS: 7
Current: Operations: DOWNTIME - REPLACE POP OFF ON #2 PUMP
Depth: 1974' Prog: 323 D Hrs: 16 1/2 AV ROP: 19.6 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $387 TMC: $6,830 TDC: $40,422 CWC: $598,468
Contracto : NT3ORS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. Flui IS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: Û.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 27 SPM: 100 size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1Í1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ Int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: GPM : 698 SIN: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: 1225 Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 6,515
Solids: AV DC: 169.3 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 131.8 Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 12.2 Jetvei: 163 FTG: 974 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2.10/3.20 ECD: 8.53 Hrs: 36.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 18000 SPR #1 : FPH: 27.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 360 sPR#2: wos: 0/50 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 387
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 12min R-RPM: 20 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 24 Total Rot. Hrs: 76.5 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 12:30 6.5 SLIDE FR 1651' -1778' @ 19.5'IHR CUTTINGS CAME BACK TO 80%-90% CEMENT - NO DROP IN ANGLE Misc. I Labor: $ 1,020

12:30 16:00 3.5 T.O.O.H. - INCREASE ANGLE OF MOTOR FROM 1.86* TO 2.12*- T.I.H. Csg. Crew: $ -

16:00 23:30 7.5 SLIDE FR 1778'-1875'@ 13'lHR - CUTTINGS WERE 95% FORMATION AND ANGLE HELD @5.2* Daily Total: $ 40,422

23:30 2:00 2.5 T.O.O.H. - DECREASE ANGLE OF MOTOR BACK TO 1.86*
- T.I.H. Cum. Wtr: $ -

2:00 4:30 2.5 DRLG FR 1875' -1974' ROT. 30' SLIDE 59' @40'/HR Cum. Fuel $ -

4:30 6:00 1.5 DOWNTIME - REPLACE POP OFF ON #2 PUMP Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

MOTOR 8" 34.46

SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

RECElVED '33 12"6" 616

D.C 8" 29.86

JUL1 6 2008 IBS 12 1/8" 5.90

D.C. 8" 58.22

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MlNING X-O&D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 640.76

Survey 1822' 5.2/82.6

24.00 Survey 1917' 4.0/80

P/U 111 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

S/O 98 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 115 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 877 On Hand: 11313 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# 1 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 3 WT G X IN CT

CONFIDEGASCO ENERGY

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/s-oV'? 3 S

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/16/08 DAYS: 7

Current: Operations: DOWNTIME - REPLACE POP OFF ON #2 PUMP
Depth: 1974' Prog: 323 D Hrs: 16 1/2 AV ROP: 19.6 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $387 TMC: $6,830 TDC: $40,422 CWC: $598,468
Contracto : NT3ORS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. Flui IS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: Û.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 27 SPM: 100 size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1Í1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ Int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: GPM : 698 SIN: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: 1225 Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 6,515
Solids: AV DC: 169.3 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 131.8 Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 12.2 Jetvei: 163 FTG: 974 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2.10/3.20 ECD: 8.53 Hrs: 36.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 18000 SPR #1 : FPH: 27.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 360 sPR#2: wos: 0/50 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 387
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 12min R-RPM: 20 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 24 Total Rot. Hrs: 76.5 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 12:30 6.5 SLIDE FR 1651' -1778' @ 19.5'IHR CUTTINGS CAME BACK TO 80%-90% CEMENT - NO DROP IN ANGLE Misc. I Labor: $ 1,020

12:30 16:00 3.5 T.O.O.H. - INCREASE ANGLE OF MOTOR FROM 1.86* TO 2.12*- T.I.H. Csg. Crew: $ -

16:00 23:30 7.5 SLIDE FR 1778'-1875'@ 13'lHR - CUTTINGS WERE 95% FORMATION AND ANGLE HELD @5.2* Daily Total: $ 40,422

23:30 2:00 2.5 T.O.O.H. - DECREASE ANGLE OF MOTOR BACK TO 1.86*
- T.I.H. Cum. Wtr: $ -

2:00 4:30 2.5 DRLG FR 1875' -1974' ROT. 30' SLIDE 59' @40'/HR Cum. Fuel $ -

4:30 6:00 1.5 DOWNTIME - REPLACE POP OFF ON #2 PUMP Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

MOTOR 8" 34.46

SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

RECElVED '33 12"6" 616

D.C 8" 29.86

JUL1 6 2008 IBS 12 1/8" 5.90

D.C. 8" 58.22

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MlNING X-O&D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 640.76

Survey 1822' 5.2/82.6

24.00 Survey 1917' 4.0/80

P/U 111 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

S/O 98 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 115 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 877 On Hand: 11313 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# 1 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 3 WT G X IN CT

CONFIDEGASCO ENERGY

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/s-oV'? 3 S

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/16/08 DAYS: 7

Current: Operations: DOWNTIME - REPLACE POP OFF ON #2 PUMP
Depth: 1974' Prog: 323 D Hrs: 16 1/2 AV ROP: 19.6 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $387 TMC: $6,830 TDC: $40,422 CWC: $598,468
Contracto : NT3ORS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. Flui IS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: Û.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 27 SPM: 100 size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1Í1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ Int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: GPM : 698 SIN: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: 1225 Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 6,515
Solids: AV DC: 169.3 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 131.8 Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 12.2 Jetvei: 163 FTG: 974 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2.10/3.20 ECD: 8.53 Hrs: 36.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 18000 SPR #1 : FPH: 27.0 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 360 sPR#2: wos: 0/50 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 387
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 12min R-RPM: 20 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 24 Total Rot. Hrs: 76.5 Daily Total: $ - Insurance $ -

6:00 12:30 6.5 SLIDE FR 1651' -1778' @ 19.5'IHR CUTTINGS CAME BACK TO 80%-90% CEMENT - NO DROP IN ANGLE Misc. I Labor: $ 1,020

12:30 16:00 3.5 T.O.O.H. - INCREASE ANGLE OF MOTOR FROM 1.86* TO 2.12*- T.I.H. Csg. Crew: $ -

16:00 23:30 7.5 SLIDE FR 1778'-1875'@ 13'lHR - CUTTINGS WERE 95% FORMATION AND ANGLE HELD @5.2* Daily Total: $ 40,422

23:30 2:00 2.5 T.O.O.H. - DECREASE ANGLE OF MOTOR BACK TO 1.86*
- T.I.H. Cum. Wtr: $ -

2:00 4:30 2.5 DRLG FR 1875' -1974' ROT. 30' SLIDE 59' @40'/HR Cum. Fuel $ -

4:30 6:00 1.5 DOWNTIME - REPLACE POP OFF ON #2 PUMP Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

MOTOR 8" 34.46

SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

RECElVED '33 12"6" 616

D.C 8" 29.86

JUL1 6 2008 IBS 12 1/8" 5.90

D.C. 8" 58.22

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MlNING X-O&D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 640.76

Survey 1822' 5.2/82.6

24.00 Survey 1917' 4.0/80

P/U 111 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

S/O 98 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 115 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 877 On Hand: 11313 Co.Man J.D.ALLEN TRIP GAS
BIT# 1 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 3 WT G X IN CT



GASCO ENERGYGAS00
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

AFE # 60507 GPs 3 58
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/18/08 DAYs: 9
Current: Operations: NIPPLE DOWN RISER TO N/U BOP
Depth: 3365' Prog: 32 D Hrs: 1/2 AV ROP: 64.0 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $900 TMC: $8,100 TDC: $292,800 CWC: $970,000
contracto: N/3ORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui SS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ 19,500
vis: 26 SPM: 100 size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ 91,800 Rig Move: $ 119,500
Pv/YP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000
WL: GPM : 698 SIN: CS267 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 1225 Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: AV DC: 169.3 To out: 3365 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 131.8 Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ 10,400
PH : 11.4 Jetvel: 163 FTG: 2415 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .70/2.10 ECD: 8.53 Hrs: 59.5 separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

ca : 160 SPR#2: WOB: 50/55 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 900
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 12min R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti me Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 99.5 Daily Total: $ 91,800 Directional tools $ 18,700
6:00 06:30 .5 DRILL FI3,333' TO 3,365' RECEIVED Misc. I Labor: $

06:30 07:30 1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRC. HOLE CLEAN Csg. Crew: $ -

07:30 09:30 2 POOH TO BHA JULI A2008 Daily Total: $ 296,100
09:30 11:30 2 LID BHA 8" DC'S & DIRECTIONAL TOOLS Cum. Wtr: $ -

11:30 12:30 1 RIU CSG CREW &WMNG Cum. Fuel $ -

12:30 13:00 0.5 HOLD PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING Cum. Bits: $ -

13:00 18:30 5.5 PIU & MIUP SHOE & FLOAT COLLAR & RIH WITH 8-5/8" J-55, 32#, STC CASING TOTAL JTS 81. TAG BHA

BOTTOM WITH JT. #82 & LID SAME. SHOE AT 3,349' & FLOAT COLLAR @3,304'

18:30 20:00 1.5 CIRC. & CHANGE OVER TO LONG BAILS

20:00 23:30 3.5 CIRC & WORK CASING WHILE WAIT ON SCHLUMBERGER CEMENTERS.

23:30 00:30 1 HOLD PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING & RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER

00:30 03:00 2.5 cMT WISCHLUMBERGER AS FOLLOWS20 BBL WATER SPACER LEAD 600 SK CLASS "G" CMT YLD=3.8E

WEIGHT 11.0, H2O 26.5. TAIL IN 260SK CLASS "G" CMT + ADDS DEN. 14.2, H2O 7.91 YLD 1.63 DISPLACE

WI201BBLSWATER BUMP PLUG 900 PSI OVER FLOAT HELD ONE BBL BACK RECIPROCATE CSG

03:00 05:00 2 WAIT ON CMT FELL BACK 80' TO 100'

05:00 06:00 1 DO TOP JOB SCHLUMBERGER PUMPED 12 BBLS CMT TO SURFACE. RID SCHLUMBERGER

TOTAL BHA = o.oo
CALLED JAMIE SPARGER WITH INTENT TO RUN SURFACE CSG & CMT SAME @ Survey 3210 2.1/168

24.00 08:30 A.M. & CALLED RANDY BYWATER WIINTENT TO T TEST BOP'S Survey 3355 1.9/169

PIU K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 521 On Hand: 10132 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 2 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 2 3 BT G 3 I WT

GASCO ENERGYGAS00
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

AFE # 60507 GPs 3 58
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/18/08 DAYs: 9

Current: Operations: NIPPLE DOWN RISER TO N/U BOP
Depth: 3365' Prog: 32 D Hrs: 1/2 AV ROP: 64.0 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $900 TMC: $8,100 TDC: $292,800 CWC: $970,000
contracto: N/3ORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui SS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ 19,500
vis: 26 SPM: 100 size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ 91,800 Rig Move: $ 119,500
Pv/YP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000
WL: GPM : 698 SIN: CS267 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 1225 Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: AV DC: 169.3 To out: 3365 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 131.8 Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ 10,400
PH : 11.4 Jetvel: 163 FTG: 2415 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .70/2.10 ECD: 8.53 Hrs: 59.5 separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

ca : 160 SPR#2: WOB: 50/55 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 900
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 12min R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti me Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 99.5 Daily Total: $ 91,800 Directional tools $ 18,700
6:00 06:30 .5 DRILL FI3,333' TO 3,365' RECEIVED Misc. I Labor: $

06:30 07:30 1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRC. HOLE CLEAN Csg. Crew: $ -

07:30 09:30 2 POOH TO BHA JULI A2008 Daily Total: $ 296,100
09:30 11:30 2 LID BHA 8" DC'S & DIRECTIONAL TOOLS Cum. Wtr: $ -

11:30 12:30 1 RIU CSG CREW &WMNG Cum. Fuel $ -

12:30 13:00 0.5 HOLD PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING Cum. Bits: $ -

13:00 18:30 5.5 PIU & MIUP SHOE & FLOAT COLLAR & RIH WITH 8-5/8" J-55, 32#, STC CASING TOTAL JTS 81. TAG BHA

BOTTOM WITH JT. #82 & LID SAME. SHOE AT 3,349' & FLOAT COLLAR @3,304'

18:30 20:00 1.5 CIRC. & CHANGE OVER TO LONG BAILS

20:00 23:30 3.5 CIRC & WORK CASING WHILE WAIT ON SCHLUMBERGER CEMENTERS.

23:30 00:30 1 HOLD PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING & RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER

00:30 03:00 2.5 cMT WISCHLUMBERGER AS FOLLOWS20 BBL WATER SPACER LEAD 600 SK CLASS "G" CMT YLD=3.8E

WEIGHT 11.0, H2O 26.5. TAIL IN 260SK CLASS "G" CMT + ADDS DEN. 14.2, H2O 7.91 YLD 1.63 DISPLACE

WI201BBLSWATER BUMP PLUG 900 PSI OVER FLOAT HELD ONE BBL BACK RECIPROCATE CSG

03:00 05:00 2 WAIT ON CMT FELL BACK 80' TO 100'

05:00 06:00 1 DO TOP JOB SCHLUMBERGER PUMPED 12 BBLS CMT TO SURFACE. RID SCHLUMBERGER

TOTAL BHA = o.oo

CALLED JAMIE SPARGER WITH INTENT TO RUN SURFACE CSG & CMT SAME @ Survey 3210 2.1/168

24.00 08:30 A.M. & CALLED RANDY BYWATER WIINTENT TO T TEST BOP'S Survey 3355 1.9/169

PIU K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 521 On Hand: 10132 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 2 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 2 3 BT G 3 I WT

GASCO ENERGYGAS00
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

AFE # 60507 GPs 3 58
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/18/08 DAYs: 9

Current: Operations: NIPPLE DOWN RISER TO N/U BOP
Depth: 3365' Prog: 32 D Hrs: 1/2 AV ROP: 64.0 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $900 TMC: $8,100 TDC: $292,800 CWC: $970,000
contracto: N/3ORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui SS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ 19,500
vis: 26 SPM: 100 size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ 91,800 Rig Move: $ 119,500
Pv/YP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000
WL: GPM : 698 SIN: CS267 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 1225 Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: AV DC: 169.3 To out: 3365 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 131.8 Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ 10,400
PH : 11.4 Jetvel: 163 FTG: 2415 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .70/2.10 ECD: 8.53 Hrs: 59.5 separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

ca : 160 SPR#2: WOB: 50/55 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 900
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 12min R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti me Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 99.5 Daily Total: $ 91,800 Directional tools $ 18,700
6:00 06:30 .5 DRILL FI3,333' TO 3,365' RECEIVED Misc. I Labor: $

06:30 07:30 1 PUMP SWEEP & CIRC. HOLE CLEAN Csg. Crew: $ -

07:30 09:30 2 POOH TO BHA JULI A2008 Daily Total: $ 296,100
09:30 11:30 2 LID BHA 8" DC'S & DIRECTIONAL TOOLS Cum. Wtr: $ -

11:30 12:30 1 RIU CSG CREW &WMNG Cum. Fuel $ -

12:30 13:00 0.5 HOLD PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING Cum. Bits: $ -

13:00 18:30 5.5 PIU & MIUP SHOE & FLOAT COLLAR & RIH WITH 8-5/8" J-55, 32#, STC CASING TOTAL JTS 81. TAG BHA

BOTTOM WITH JT. #82 & LID SAME. SHOE AT 3,349' & FLOAT COLLAR @3,304'

18:30 20:00 1.5 CIRC. & CHANGE OVER TO LONG BAILS

20:00 23:30 3.5 CIRC & WORK CASING WHILE WAIT ON SCHLUMBERGER CEMENTERS.

23:30 00:30 1 HOLD PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING & RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER

00:30 03:00 2.5 cMT WISCHLUMBERGER AS FOLLOWS20 BBL WATER SPACER LEAD 600 SK CLASS "G" CMT YLD=3.8E

WEIGHT 11.0, H2O 26.5. TAIL IN 260SK CLASS "G" CMT + ADDS DEN. 14.2, H2O 7.91 YLD 1.63 DISPLACE

WI201BBLSWATER BUMP PLUG 900 PSI OVER FLOAT HELD ONE BBL BACK RECIPROCATE CSG

03:00 05:00 2 WAIT ON CMT FELL BACK 80' TO 100'

05:00 06:00 1 DO TOP JOB SCHLUMBERGER PUMPED 12 BBLS CMT TO SURFACE. RID SCHLUMBERGER

TOTAL BHA = o.oo

CALLED JAMIE SPARGER WITH INTENT TO RUN SURFACE CSG & CMT SAME @ Survey 3210 2.1/168

24.00 08:30 A.M. & CALLED RANDY BYWATER WIINTENT TO T TEST BOP'S Survey 3355 1.9/169

PIU K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 521 On Hand: 10132 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 2 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 2 3 BT G 3 I WT



CONFIDENTIR
GA800 GASCO ENERGY as gg

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT */-3~'~
- 3 9 9 f(o

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 S: 3 8.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE ÝIi7/08 DAYS: 8

current:Operations: DRILLING AHE
Depth: 3330' Prog: 1356 D Hrs: 22 1/2 AV RoP: 60.3 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $370 TMC: $7,200 TDC: $78,732 CWC: $677,200
Contracto : N/ 3ORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 26 SPM: 100 size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PviYP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000

Gel: SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000

WL: GPM : 698 SIN: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 2,700

Cake: Press: 1225 Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: AV DC: 169.3 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 131.8 Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 11.7 Jetvel: 163 FTG: 2380 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1.20/3.80 ECD: 8.53 Hrs: 59 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 400 SPR#2: WOB: 45/55 PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 370
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 12min R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 650

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 99.0 Daily Total: $ - Directional tools $ 43,012

6:00 07:00 1 REBUILD POP OFF ON #2 MUD PUMP. Misc.I Labor: $
07:00 18:00 11 ROTARY DRILL FI1,974' TO 2,637· ROP = 60' Csg. Crew: $ -

18:00 18:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE Daily Total: $ 78,732

18:30 20:00 1.5 ROTARY DRILL FI2,637' TO 2,765' Cum. Wtr: $ -

20:00 21:30 1.5 SLIDE DRILL FI2,765' TO 2,800' Cum. Fuel $ -

21:30 6:00 8.5 ROTARY DRILL FI2,800' TO 3,330' ROP = 62' Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

MOTOR 8" 34.46

SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

RECFivFD MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

IBS 12 1/8" 6.15

JUL1 / 2008 D.C. 8" 29.86

IBS 12 1/8" 5.90

DIV,OFOIL,GAS&MINING D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O & D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 640.76

Survey 3210 2.1/168

24.00 survey 2 1/9 1.9/169

PIU 128 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO 120 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 124 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1722 On Hand: 9591 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 2 ICS OCS DC LOC BIS G ODC RP

CONFIDENTIR
GA800 GASCO ENERGY as gg

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT */-3~'~
- 3 9 9 f(o

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 S: 3 8.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE ÝIi7/08 DAYS: 8

current:Operations: DRILLING AHE
Depth: 3330' Prog: 1356 D Hrs: 22 1/2 AV RoP: 60.3 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $370 TMC: $7,200 TDC: $78,732 CWC: $677,200
Contracto : N/ 3ORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 26 SPM: 100 size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PviYP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000

Gel: SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000

WL: GPM : 698 SIN: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 2,700

Cake: Press: 1225 Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: AV DC: 169.3 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 131.8 Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 11.7 Jetvel: 163 FTG: 2380 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1.20/3.80 ECD: 8.53 Hrs: 59 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 400 SPR#2: WOB: 45/55 PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 370
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 12min R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 650

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 99.0 Daily Total: $ - Directional tools $ 43,012

6:00 07:00 1 REBUILD POP OFF ON #2 MUD PUMP. Misc.I Labor: $
07:00 18:00 11 ROTARY DRILL FI1,974' TO 2,637· ROP = 60' Csg. Crew: $ -

18:00 18:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE Daily Total: $ 78,732

18:30 20:00 1.5 ROTARY DRILL FI2,637' TO 2,765' Cum. Wtr: $ -

20:00 21:30 1.5 SLIDE DRILL FI2,765' TO 2,800' Cum. Fuel $ -

21:30 6:00 8.5 ROTARY DRILL FI2,800' TO 3,330' ROP = 62' Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

MOTOR 8" 34.46

SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

RECFivFD MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

IBS 12 1/8" 6.15

JUL1 / 2008 D.C. 8" 29.86

IBS 12 1/8" 5.90

DIV,OFOIL,GAS&MINING D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O & D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 640.76

Survey 3210 2.1/168

24.00 survey 2 1/9 1.9/169

PIU 128 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO 120 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 124 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1722 On Hand: 9591 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 2 ICS OCS DC LOC BIS G ODC RP

CONFIDENTIR
GA800 GASCO ENERGY as gg

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT */-3~'~
- 3 9 9 f(o

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 S: 3 8.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE ÝIi7/08 DAYS: 8

current:Operations: DRILLING AHE
Depth: 3330' Prog: 1356 D Hrs: 22 1/2 AV RoP: 60.3 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $370 TMC: $7,200 TDC: $78,732 CWC: $677,200
Contracto : N/ 3ORS 99 Mud Co: M-IDrlg. Flui iS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 sit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 26 SPM: 100 size: 12 1/4 surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $
PviYP: 1/1 #2 Type: Z27KRSJ int. csg: $ - Day Rate:Moving $ 24,000

Gel: SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000

WL: GPM : 698 SIN: CS267 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 2,700

Cake: Press: 1225 Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: AV DC: 169.3 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 131.8 Depth In: 950 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 11.7 Jetvel: 163 FTG: 2380 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1.20/3.80 ECD: 8.53 Hrs: 59 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - Title/Abstract $ -

Ca : 400 SPR#2: WOB: 45/55 PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 370
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 12min R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 650

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 112 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 99.0 Daily Total: $ - Directional tools $ 43,012

6:00 07:00 1 REBUILD POP OFF ON #2 MUD PUMP. Misc.I Labor: $
07:00 18:00 11 ROTARY DRILL FI1,974' TO 2,637· ROP = 60' Csg. Crew: $ -

18:00 18:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE Daily Total: $ 78,732

18:30 20:00 1.5 ROTARY DRILL FI2,637' TO 2,765' Cum. Wtr: $ -

20:00 21:30 1.5 SLIDE DRILL FI2,765' TO 2,800' Cum. Fuel $ -

21:30 6:00 8.5 ROTARY DRILL FI2,800' TO 3,330' ROP = 62' Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA

BIT 12 1/4" 1.00

MOTOR 8" 34.46

SHOCK SUB 8" 8.50

RECFivFD MULESHOE/MONEL 8" 33.14

IBS 12 1/8" 6.15

JUL1 / 2008 D.C. 8" 29.86

IBS 12 1/8" 5.90

DIV,OFOIL,GAS&MINING D.C. 8" 58.22

X-O & D.C. 6" 463.53

TOTAL BHA = 640.76

Survey 3210 2.1/168

24.00 survey 2 1/9 1.9/169

PIU 128 K# LITH: Centrifuge: BKG GAS

SIO 120 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. 124 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 16" SET @ 60' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1722 On Hand: 9591 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 2 ICS OCS DC LOC BIS G ODC RP



Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES < . FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to mnter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. TypeofWell NA
Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, See . T. R . M. or Survey Description) Utel and Butte
159]' FNI & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish. State

SE NE of Sec l l-Tl0S-RI8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDlCATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Plug back

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon Surface hole and redrill

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen dirœtionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BlA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involval operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(M shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all raiuirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

Verbal approval was received from Matt Baker on 7/12/08 to plug back the surface hole and redrill due to
excessive deviation.

Surveys were as follows:
450' -

0.5°
: 960' -

1° ; 1456' -

2° : 2030' -

10° ; 2225' - 11° ; 2320' -

12°

Cement plugs were set as follows: RECEIVEDPlug #1; 400 sxs @ 15.8 ppg 2350 - 1850' tagged @ 1865'
Plug #2: 400 sxs @ 15.8 ppg 1865 - 1350' tagged @ 1367' JUL18Plug #3; 350 sxs @ 15.8 ppg 1367' - 1000' tagged @950' ËÊ
Waited 24 hours on cement, picked up drilling assembly to redrill surface hole. DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

14 I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Primed 7pped)

Title
gnCa

ur Date
1

5M2a er

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES < . FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to mnter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. TypeofWell NA
Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, See . T. R . M. or Survey Description) Utel and Butte
159]' FNI & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish. State

SE NE of Sec l l-Tl0S-RI8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDlCATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Plug back

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon Surface hole and redrill

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen dirœtionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BlA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involval operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(M shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all raiuirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

Verbal approval was received from Matt Baker on 7/12/08 to plug back the surface hole and redrill due to
excessive deviation.

Surveys were as follows:
450' -

0.5°
: 960' -

1° ; 1456' -

2° : 2030' -

10° ; 2225' - 11° ; 2320' -

12°

Cement plugs were set as follows: RECEIVEDPlug #1; 400 sxs @ 15.8 ppg 2350 - 1850' tagged @ 1865'
Plug #2: 400 sxs @ 15.8 ppg 1865 - 1350' tagged @ 1367' JUL18Plug #3; 350 sxs @ 15.8 ppg 1367' - 1000' tagged @950' ËÊ
Waited 24 hours on cement, picked up drilling assembly to redrill surface hole. DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

14 I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Primed 7pped)

Title
gnCa

ur Date
1

5M2a er

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES < . FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to mnter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. TypeofWell NA
Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, See . T. R . M. or Survey Description) Utel and Butte
159]' FNI & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish. State

SE NE of Sec l l-Tl0S-RI8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDlCATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Plug back

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon Surface hole and redrill

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen dirœtionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BlA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involval operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(M shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all raiuirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

Verbal approval was received from Matt Baker on 7/12/08 to plug back the surface hole and redrill due to
excessive deviation.

Surveys were as follows:
450' -

0.5°
: 960' -

1° ; 1456' -

2° : 2030' -

10° ; 2225' - 11° ; 2320' -

12°

Cement plugs were set as follows: RECEIVEDPlug #1; 400 sxs @ 15.8 ppg 2350 - 1850' tagged @ 1865'
Plug #2: 400 sxs @ 15.8 ppg 1865 - 1350' tagged @ 1367' JUL18Plug #3; 350 sxs @ 15.8 ppg 1367' - 1000' tagged @950' ËÊ
Waited 24 hours on cement, picked up drilling assembly to redrill surface hole. DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

14 I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Primed 7pped)

Title
gnCa

ur Date
1

5M2a er

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page



CONFIDENTIAL
GA800 GASCO ENERGY T'/a.s R 19E s-t/

DAILY DRILLING REPORT L{3-0 - gg §§§
Energy uramo o

RKB: 25.6'
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/21/08 DAYS: 12
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 6618' Prog: 2160 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 91.9 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $2,300 TMC: $10,400 TDC: $33,300 CWC: $1,134,800
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 26 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10 Type: MS 1655CDU int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000
WL: GPM : 386 SIN: 5397 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 850 Jets: 4X18 1X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 0.7 AV DC: 293.3 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 178.3 Depth In: 3365 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 9.7 Jetvei: 94 FTG: 1093 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .50/1.90 ECD: 8.6 Hrs: 33 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 98.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 12/24 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,300
Dap: 2 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti Tie Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 109.0 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 16:00 10 DRILL FI4,458' TO 5,470' ROP = 101' NOTE: FI4,710' TO 4,970' SLOWED PUMP DOWN Misc. I Labor: $500

TO 100 SPM & TOP DRIVE FI50 TO 40 RPM DUE TO SANDSTONE STRINGERS. Csg. Crew: $ -

16:00 16:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE Daily Total: $ 33,300

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL FI5,470' TO 6,618' ROP = 85' Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435

Cum. Fuel $ 61,155
cum.sits: $ 20,000

BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

RECEIVED MOTORSTB 6-1/2 35.57

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

JUL2 1 2008 STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING STAB 7 3/4 5.72

17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

SURVEY'S 4465' WAS 2.6*, 5048'WAS2.9*, 5426' WAS 2.7*, 5811' WAS 2.7, 6200' WAS 2.8

TOTAL BHA = 609.69

Survey 5811 2.7

Survey 6200 2.8

P/U 182 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS

S/O 164 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS

ROT. 175 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1425 On Hand: 7312 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFIDENTIAL
GA800 GASCO ENERGY T'/a.s R 19E s-t/

DAILY DRILLING REPORT L{3-0 - gg §§§
Energy uramo o

RKB: 25.6'
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/21/08 DAYS: 12
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 6618' Prog: 2160 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 91.9 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $2,300 TMC: $10,400 TDC: $33,300 CWC: $1,134,800
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 26 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10 Type: MS 1655CDU int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000
WL: GPM : 386 SIN: 5397 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 850 Jets: 4X18 1X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 0.7 AV DC: 293.3 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 178.3 Depth In: 3365 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 9.7 Jetvei: 94 FTG: 1093 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .50/1.90 ECD: 8.6 Hrs: 33 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 98.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 12/24 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,300
Dap: 2 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti Tie Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 109.0 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 16:00 10 DRILL FI4,458' TO 5,470' ROP = 101' NOTE: FI4,710' TO 4,970' SLOWED PUMP DOWN Misc. I Labor: $500

TO 100 SPM & TOP DRIVE FI50 TO 40 RPM DUE TO SANDSTONE STRINGERS. Csg. Crew: $ -

16:00 16:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE Daily Total: $ 33,300

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL FI5,470' TO 6,618' ROP = 85' Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435

Cum. Fuel $ 61,155
cum.sits: $ 20,000

BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

RECEIVED MOTORSTB 6-1/2 35.57

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

JUL2 1 2008 STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING STAB 7 3/4 5.72

17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

SURVEY'S 4465' WAS 2.6*, 5048'WAS2.9*, 5426' WAS 2.7*, 5811' WAS 2.7, 6200' WAS 2.8

TOTAL BHA = 609.69

Survey 5811 2.7

Survey 6200 2.8

P/U 182 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS

S/O 164 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS

ROT. 175 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1425 On Hand: 7312 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFIDENTIAL
GA800 GASCO ENERGY T'/a.s R 19E s-t/

DAILY DRILLING REPORT L{3-0 - gg §§§
Energy uramo o

RKB: 25.6'
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/21/08 DAYS: 12
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 6618' Prog: 2160 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 91.9 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $2,300 TMC: $10,400 TDC: $33,300 CWC: $1,134,800
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 26 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10 Type: MS 1655CDU int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000
WL: GPM : 386 SIN: 5397 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 850 Jets: 4X18 1X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 0.7 AV DC: 293.3 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: 178.3 Depth In: 3365 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 9.7 Jetvei: 94 FTG: 1093 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .50/1.90 ECD: 8.6 Hrs: 33 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 98.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 12/24 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,300
Dap: 2 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti Tie Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 109.0 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 16:00 10 DRILL FI4,458' TO 5,470' ROP = 101' NOTE: FI4,710' TO 4,970' SLOWED PUMP DOWN Misc. I Labor: $500

TO 100 SPM & TOP DRIVE FI50 TO 40 RPM DUE TO SANDSTONE STRINGERS. Csg. Crew: $ -

16:00 16:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE Daily Total: $ 33,300

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL FI5,470' TO 6,618' ROP = 85' Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435

Cum. Fuel $ 61,155
cum.sits: $ 20,000

BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

RECEIVED MOTORSTB 6-1/2 35.57

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

JUL2 1 2008 STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&MINING STAB 7 3/4 5.72

17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

SURVEY'S 4465' WAS 2.6*, 5048'WAS2.9*, 5426' WAS 2.7*, 5811' WAS 2.7, 6200' WAS 2.8

TOTAL BHA = 609.69

Survey 5811 2.7

Survey 6200 2.8

P/U 182 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS

S/O 164 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS

ROT. 175 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1425 On Hand: 7312 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP



CONFIDENFALGASCO ENERGY '

DAILY DRILLING REPORT L/ 3 OVQ- 3 Sí aEn TVV
DI AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.|4

RKB:25.6' I / T/5|--AA r

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/22/08 DAYS: 13

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 7897' Prog: 1279 D Hrs: 23 1/2 Av RoP: 54.4 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $7,200 TMC: $17,600 TDC: $70,700 CWC: $1,205,500
contracto: N/ 30RS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ i0 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 26 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 Type: MS 1655CDU Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 1/1 SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000

WL: DC GPM : 386 SIN: 5397 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 850 Jets: 4X18 1X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 0.7 AV DC: 293.3 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 32,500
MBT AV DP: 178.3 Depth in: 3365 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 8.5 Jetvel: 94 FTG: 4532 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: .10/3.40 ECD: 8.6 Nrs: 56.5 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 80.2 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 12/24 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 7,200
Dap: 3.5 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti Ile Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 156.0 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 16:30 10.5 DRILL FI6,618' TO 7,380' ROP = 72.57' Misc. I Labor: $500
16:30 17:00 .5 RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -

17:00 06:00 13 DRILL FI7,380' TO 7,89T ROP = 40' Daily Total: $ 70,700

cum.wtr: $ 11,435
Cum. Fuel $ 93,655

SURVEY'S 6,953' WAS 2.2, 7,334' WAS 2.2, 7,813' WAS 1.9DEGREE Cum. Bits: $ 20,000
BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

MOTOR STB 6-1/2 35.57

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

STAB 7 3/4 5.72

JUL? 7 2008 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MININA
TOTAL BHA = 609.69

Survey 7334 2.2

Survey 7813 1.9

P/U 182 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS

SIO 164 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS

ROT. 175 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET g 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1478 On Hand: 12555 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFIDENFALGASCO ENERGY '

DAILY DRILLING REPORT L/ 3 OVQ- 3 Sí aEn TVV
DI AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.|4

RKB:25.6' I / T/5|--AA r

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/22/08 DAYS: 13

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 7897' Prog: 1279 D Hrs: 23 1/2 Av RoP: 54.4 Formation: UINTA

DMC: $7,200 TMC: $17,600 TDC: $70,700 CWC: $1,205,500
contracto: N/ 30RS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ i0 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 26 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 Type: MS 1655CDU Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 1/1 SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000

WL: DC GPM : 386 SIN: 5397 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 850 Jets: 4X18 1X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 0.7 AV DC: 293.3 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 32,500

MBT AV DP: 178.3 Depth in: 3365 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 8.5 Jetvel: 94 FTG: 4532 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: .10/3.40 ECD: 8.6 Nrs: 56.5 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 80.2 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 12/24 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 7,200
Dap: 3.5 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti Ile Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 156.0 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 16:30 10.5 DRILL FI6,618' TO 7,380' ROP = 72.57' Misc. I Labor: $500
16:30 17:00 .5 RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -

17:00 06:00 13 DRILL FI7,380' TO 7,89T ROP = 40' Daily Total: $ 70,700

cum.wtr: $ 11,435
Cum. Fuel $ 93,655

SURVEY'S 6,953' WAS 2.2, 7,334' WAS 2.2, 7,813' WAS 1.9DEGREE Cum. Bits: $ 20,000
BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

MOTOR STB 6-1/2 35.57

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

STAB 7 3/4 5.72

JUL? 7 2008 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MININA
TOTAL BHA = 609.69

Survey 7334 2.2

Survey 7813 1.9

P/U 182 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS

SIO 164 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS

ROT. 175 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET g 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1478 On Hand: 12555 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFIDENFALGASCO ENERGY '

DAILY DRILLING REPORT L/ 3 OVQ- 3 Sí aEn TVV
DI AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.|4

RKB:25.6' I / T/5|--AA r

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/22/08 DAYS: 13

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 7897' Prog: 1279 D Hrs: 23 1/2 Av RoP: 54.4 Formation: UINTA

DMC: $7,200 TMC: $17,600 TDC: $70,700 CWC: $1,205,500
contracto: N/ 30RS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 8.5 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ i0 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 26 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 1/1 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 Type: MS 1655CDU Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 1/1 SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,000

WL: DC GPM : 386 SIN: 5397 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 850 Jets: 4X18 1X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 0.7 AV DC: 293.3 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 32,500

MBT AV DP: 178.3 Depth in: 3365 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 8.5 Jetvel: 94 FTG: 4532 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: .10/3.40 ECD: 8.6 Nrs: 56.5 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 80.2 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 12/24 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 7,200
Dap: 3.5 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti Ile Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 156.0 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 16:30 10.5 DRILL FI6,618' TO 7,380' ROP = 72.57' Misc. I Labor: $500
16:30 17:00 .5 RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -

17:00 06:00 13 DRILL FI7,380' TO 7,89T ROP = 40' Daily Total: $ 70,700

cum.wtr: $ 11,435
Cum. Fuel $ 93,655

SURVEY'S 6,953' WAS 2.2, 7,334' WAS 2.2, 7,813' WAS 1.9DEGREE Cum. Bits: $ 20,000
BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

MOTOR STB 6-1/2 35.57

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

STAB 7 3/4 5.72

JUL? 7 2008 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MININA
TOTAL BHA = 609.69

Survey 7334 2.2

Survey 7813 1.9

P/U 182 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS

SIO 164 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS

ROT. 175 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET g 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1478 On Hand: 12555 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS
BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP



CONFIDENTIAL
GASCO GASCOENERGY /d5 RR 5-0

DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3- ØC/P- 3 f (o

Energy
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/23/08 DAYS: 14

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 8340' Prog: 386 D Hrs: 9 AV ROP: 42.9 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $11,600 TMC: $29,200 TDC: $48,350 CWC: $1,253,850
Contracto : NI BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE CÓST

MW: $.8 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: - RAT HOLE

vis: 32 SPM: Size: T-7/8" 7/7/2008 surf.csg: $ Rig iviove: $
PVIYP: 5/6 #2 Gardner-Denver IE 10 Type: MS 1655CDU MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate $ 24,000
Gel: 1/2 SAM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 14 GPM 386 SIN: 5397 5339 Float Equp: Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1380 Jets: 4X18 1X16 6X16 Well Head: - Water: $ 4,700
Solids: 2.3 AV DC: 293.3 TD Out: 7954 IN HOLE TBGIRods: - Fuel:

MBT 8 AV DP: 178.3 Depth In: 3365 7954 Packers: - Casing Crew: $
ÞH : 8.0 Jetvel: 94 FTG: 4589 386 Tanks: - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.9 ECD: 8.6 Hrs: 62 9 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 18000 SPR #1 : FPH: 74.0 42.9 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca: 40 SPR#2: WOB: 22/32 22/29 ËumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 11,600
Dap: 4.5 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 25/55 Þrime Mover: $ - Camps $ 1,050

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 60 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs Û.Ò Daily Total: Directional tools $
6:00 11:30 5.5 DRILL FI7,897' TO 7,954' Misc.I Labor: $
11:30 12:00 .5 PUMP swEEP AROUND & SI..UG DRILL PIPE Csg. Crew: -

12:00 16:30 4.5 POOH FOR BIT Daily Total: $ 48,350

16:30 20:30 4 MIU BIT & RIH & BREAK CIRC. @4,000' Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435
20:30 21;00 0.5 WASH & REAM TO BOTTOM 12' FILL & BREAKIN BIT Cum. Fuei $ 93,655
21:00 06:00 9 DRILL FI7,954' TO 8,340' ROP = 43' Cum. Bits: $ 20,000

BHA

NOTEON TRIP WE WERE ONE STAND OFF ON PIPE ADJUST DEPTH ACCORDINGLY BIT 7-7/8 1.00

LAST SURVEY WAS 7,919' = 2.4* MM .16 STAB 6-1/2 35 57 .

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

STAB 7.75 5.70

REC6l ED DC 6-1/2 31.34

9 O STAB 7 3/4 5.72

LOWER MESAVERDE 5170' TO 10, 28' GRASSY 6340' TO 11,298' 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

YOF CASTLEGATE SANDSTONE: 6010' TO 10,968' SUNNYSIDE: 0480' TO 11,228'

DESERT: 6260' TO 11,218' KENILWORTH: 6720' TO 11,438'

ABERDEEN: 6830' TO 11,788' TOTAL BHA = 609.69

MANCOS: 7085' TO 12,043' Survey 7919 2.4

Survey

PlU 220 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS NA

S/O 178 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS NA

ROT. 210 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET 3349' PEAK GAS NA

FUEL Used: 1312 ÓnHand: 11243 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 2 wT e X i NA

CONFIDENTIAL
GASCO GASCOENERGY /d5 RR 5-0

DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3- ØC/P- 3 f (o

Energy
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/23/08 DAYS: 14

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 8340' Prog: 386 D Hrs: 9 AV ROP: 42.9 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $11,600 TMC: $29,200 TDC: $48,350 CWC: $1,253,850
Contracto : NI BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE CÓST

MW: $.8 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: - RAT HOLE

vis: 32 SPM: Size: T-7/8" 7/7/2008 surf.csg: $ Rig iviove: $
PVIYP: 5/6 #2 Gardner-Denver IE 10 Type: MS 1655CDU MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate $ 24,000
Gel: 1/2 SAM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 14 GPM 386 SIN: 5397 5339 Float Equp: Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1380 Jets: 4X18 1X16 6X16 Well Head: - Water: $ 4,700
Solids: 2.3 AV DC: 293.3 TD Out: 7954 IN HOLE TBGIRods: - Fuel:

MBT 8 AV DP: 178.3 Depth In: 3365 7954 Packers: - Casing Crew: $
ÞH : 8.0 Jetvel: 94 FTG: 4589 386 Tanks: - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.9 ECD: 8.6 Hrs: 62 9 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 18000 SPR #1 : FPH: 74.0 42.9 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca: 40 SPR#2: WOB: 22/32 22/29 ËumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 11,600
Dap: 4.5 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 25/55 Þrime Mover: $ - Camps $ 1,050

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 60 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs Û.Ò Daily Total: Directional tools $
6:00 11:30 5.5 DRILL FI7,897' TO 7,954' Misc.I Labor: $
11:30 12:00 .5 PUMP swEEP AROUND & SI..UG DRILL PIPE Csg. Crew: -

12:00 16:30 4.5 POOH FOR BIT Daily Total: $ 48,350

16:30 20:30 4 MIU BIT & RIH & BREAK CIRC. @4,000' Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435
20:30 21;00 0.5 WASH & REAM TO BOTTOM 12' FILL & BREAKIN BIT Cum. Fuei $ 93,655
21:00 06:00 9 DRILL FI7,954' TO 8,340' ROP = 43' Cum. Bits: $ 20,000

BHA

NOTEON TRIP WE WERE ONE STAND OFF ON PIPE ADJUST DEPTH ACCORDINGLY BIT 7-7/8 1.00

LAST SURVEY WAS 7,919' = 2.4* MM .16 STAB 6-1/2 35 57 .

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

STAB 7.75 5.70

REC6l ED DC 6-1/2 31.34

9 O STAB 7 3/4 5.72

LOWER MESAVERDE 5170' TO 10, 28' GRASSY 6340' TO 11,298' 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

YOF CASTLEGATE SANDSTONE: 6010' TO 10,968' SUNNYSIDE: 0480' TO 11,228'

DESERT: 6260' TO 11,218' KENILWORTH: 6720' TO 11,438'

ABERDEEN: 6830' TO 11,788' TOTAL BHA = 609.69

MANCOS: 7085' TO 12,043' Survey 7919 2.4

Survey

PlU 220 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS NA

S/O 178 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS NA

ROT. 210 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET 3349' PEAK GAS NA

FUEL Used: 1312 ÓnHand: 11243 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 2 wT e X i NA

CONFIDENTIAL
GASCO GASCOENERGY /d5 RR 5-0

DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3- ØC/P- 3 f (o

Energy
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/23/08 DAYS: 14

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 8340' Prog: 386 D Hrs: 9 AV ROP: 42.9 Formation: UINTA
DMC: $11,600 TMC: $29,200 TDC: $48,350 CWC: $1,253,850
Contracto : NI BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE CÓST

MW: $.8 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: - RAT HOLE

vis: 32 SPM: Size: T-7/8" 7/7/2008 surf.csg: $ Rig iviove: $
PVIYP: 5/6 #2 Gardner-Denver IE 10 Type: MS 1655CDU MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate $ 24,000
Gel: 1/2 SAM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 14 GPM 386 SIN: 5397 5339 Float Equp: Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1380 Jets: 4X18 1X16 6X16 Well Head: - Water: $ 4,700
Solids: 2.3 AV DC: 293.3 TD Out: 7954 IN HOLE TBGIRods: - Fuel:

MBT 8 AV DP: 178.3 Depth In: 3365 7954 Packers: - Casing Crew: $
ÞH : 8.0 Jetvel: 94 FTG: 4589 386 Tanks: - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.9 ECD: 8.6 Hrs: 62 9 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 18000 SPR #1 : FPH: 74.0 42.9 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca: 40 SPR#2: WOB: 22/32 22/29 ËumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 11,600
Dap: 4.5 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 25/55 Þrime Mover: $ - Camps $ 1,050

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 60 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs Û.Ò Daily Total: Directional tools $
6:00 11:30 5.5 DRILL FI7,897' TO 7,954' Misc.I Labor: $
11:30 12:00 .5 PUMP swEEP AROUND & SI..UG DRILL PIPE Csg. Crew: -

12:00 16:30 4.5 POOH FOR BIT Daily Total: $ 48,350

16:30 20:30 4 MIU BIT & RIH & BREAK CIRC. @4,000' Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435
20:30 21;00 0.5 WASH & REAM TO BOTTOM 12' FILL & BREAKIN BIT Cum. Fuei $ 93,655
21:00 06:00 9 DRILL FI7,954' TO 8,340' ROP = 43' Cum. Bits: $ 20,000

BHA

NOTEON TRIP WE WERE ONE STAND OFF ON PIPE ADJUST DEPTH ACCORDINGLY BIT 7-7/8 1.00

LAST SURVEY WAS 7,919' = 2.4* MM .16 STAB 6-1/2 35 57 .

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

STAB 7.75 5.70

REC6l ED DC 6-1/2 31.34

9 O STAB 7 3/4 5.72

LOWER MESAVERDE 5170' TO 10, 28' GRASSY 6340' TO 11,298' 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

YOF CASTLEGATE SANDSTONE: 6010' TO 10,968' SUNNYSIDE: 0480' TO 11,228'

DESERT: 6260' TO 11,218' KENILWORTH: 6720' TO 11,438'

ABERDEEN: 6830' TO 11,788' TOTAL BHA = 609.69

MANCOS: 7085' TO 12,043' Survey 7919 2.4

Survey

PlU 220 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS NA

S/O 178 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS NA

ROT. 210 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET 3349' PEAK GAS NA

FUEL Used: 1312 ÓnHand: 11243 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 1 2 wT e X i NA



CONFllENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY pa_s ggg. s-n

DAILY DRILLING REPORT y2-6y 3gg ŸÚ
Energv urews «c

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/24/08 DAYS: 15

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 9250' Prog: 910 D Hrs: 24 AV RoP: 37.9 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $4,000 TMC: $33,200 TDC: $46,100 CWC: $1,299,950
Contracto : NABORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 34 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" 7/7/2008 surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 6/8 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 Type: MS 1655CDU MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000

Gel: 1/2 SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 11.6 GPM : 386 SIN: 5397 5339 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1380 Jets: 4X18 1X16 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 3.8 AV DC: 293.3 To out: 7954 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT 8 AV DP: 178.3 Depth In: 3365 7954 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 7.9 Jetvel: 94 FTo: 4589 1296 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.8 ECD: 8.6 Hrs: 62 33 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 18000 SPR #1 : FPH: 74.0 39.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 28/32 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,000
Dap: 4.5 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 30-Oct Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 60 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 194.5 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 06:00 24 DRILL Fl8,340 TO 9,250' ROP = 38' Misc. I Labor: $11,100

Csg. Crew: $ -

LAST SURVEY @9,053' WAS 2.6 DEGREE Daily Total: $ 46,100
cum.wtr: $ 11,435
Cum. Fuel $ 93,655
Cum. Bits: $ 20,000

RECEIVED BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

JUL2 4 2008 MM.16STAB 6-1/2 35.57

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

STAB 7 3/4 5.72

LOWER MESAVERDE: 5170' TO 10,128' GRASSY 6340' TO 11,298' 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

CASTLEGATE SANDSTONE: 6010' TO 10,968' SUNNYSIDE: 6480' TO 11,228'

DESERT: 6260' TO 11,218' KENILWORTH: 6720' TO 11,438'

ABERDEEN: 6830' TO 11,788' TOTAL BHA = 609.69

MANCOS: 7085' TO 12,043' Survey 8386 2.1

Survey 9053 2.6

P/U 220 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS 18
SIO 178 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 150

ROT. 210 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 675
FUEL Used: 1425 On Hand: 10866 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA

BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
CONDITION 1 2 WT G X \ NA

CONFllENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY pa_s ggg. s-n

DAILY DRILLING REPORT y2-6y 3gg ŸÚ
Energv urews «c

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/24/08 DAYS: 15

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 9250' Prog: 910 D Hrs: 24 AV RoP: 37.9 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $4,000 TMC: $33,200 TDC: $46,100 CWC: $1,299,950
Contracto : NABORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 34 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" 7/7/2008 surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 6/8 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 Type: MS 1655CDU MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000

Gel: 1/2 SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 11.6 GPM : 386 SIN: 5397 5339 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1380 Jets: 4X18 1X16 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 3.8 AV DC: 293.3 To out: 7954 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT 8 AV DP: 178.3 Depth In: 3365 7954 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 7.9 Jetvel: 94 FTo: 4589 1296 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.8 ECD: 8.6 Hrs: 62 33 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 18000 SPR #1 : FPH: 74.0 39.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 28/32 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,000
Dap: 4.5 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 30-Oct Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 60 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 194.5 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 06:00 24 DRILL Fl8,340 TO 9,250' ROP = 38' Misc. I Labor: $11,100

Csg. Crew: $ -

LAST SURVEY @9,053' WAS 2.6 DEGREE Daily Total: $ 46,100
cum.wtr: $ 11,435
Cum. Fuel $ 93,655
Cum. Bits: $ 20,000

RECEIVED BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

JUL2 4 2008 MM.16STAB 6-1/2 35.57

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

STAB 7 3/4 5.72

LOWER MESAVERDE: 5170' TO 10,128' GRASSY 6340' TO 11,298' 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

CASTLEGATE SANDSTONE: 6010' TO 10,968' SUNNYSIDE: 6480' TO 11,228'

DESERT: 6260' TO 11,218' KENILWORTH: 6720' TO 11,438'

ABERDEEN: 6830' TO 11,788' TOTAL BHA = 609.69

MANCOS: 7085' TO 12,043' Survey 8386 2.1

Survey 9053 2.6

P/U 220 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS 18

SIO 178 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 150

ROT. 210 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 675
FUEL Used: 1425 On Hand: 10866 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA

BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
CONDITION 1 2 WT G X \ NA

CONFllENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY pa_s ggg. s-n

DAILY DRILLING REPORT y2-6y 3gg ŸÚ
Energv urews «c

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/24/08 DAYS: 15

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 9250' Prog: 910 D Hrs: 24 AV RoP: 37.9 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $4,000 TMC: $33,200 TDC: $46,100 CWC: $1,299,950
Contracto : NABORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 34 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" 7/7/2008 surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 6/8 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 Type: MS 1655CDU MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000

Gel: 1/2 SPM: 110 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 11.6 GPM : 386 SIN: 5397 5339 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1380 Jets: 4X18 1X16 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 3.8 AV DC: 293.3 To out: 7954 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT 8 AV DP: 178.3 Depth In: 3365 7954 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 7.9 Jetvel: 94 FTo: 4589 1296 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.8 ECD: 8.6 Hrs: 62 33 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 18000 SPR #1 : FPH: 74.0 39.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 22/32 28/32 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,000
Dap: 4.5 Btm.Up: R-RPM: 40/50 30-Oct Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 64/70 60 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 194.5 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 06:00 24 DRILL Fl8,340 TO 9,250' ROP = 38' Misc. I Labor: $11,100

Csg. Crew: $ -

LAST SURVEY @9,053' WAS 2.6 DEGREE Daily Total: $ 46,100
cum.wtr: $ 11,435
Cum. Fuel $ 93,655
Cum. Bits: $ 20,000

RECEIVED BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

JUL2 4 2008 MM.16STAB 6-1/2 35.57

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

STAB 7 3/4 5.72

LOWER MESAVERDE: 5170' TO 10,128' GRASSY 6340' TO 11,298' 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

CASTLEGATE SANDSTONE: 6010' TO 10,968' SUNNYSIDE: 6480' TO 11,228'

DESERT: 6260' TO 11,218' KENILWORTH: 6720' TO 11,438'

ABERDEEN: 6830' TO 11,788' TOTAL BHA = 609.69

MANCOS: 7085' TO 12,043' Survey 8386 2.1

Survey 9053 2.6

P/U 220 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS 18

SIO 178 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 150

ROT. 210 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 675
FUEL Used: 1425 On Hand: 10866 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA

BIT# 3 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
CONDITION 1 2 WT G X \ NA



CONFllENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY yyas gigg en

DAILY DRILLING REPORT L 3-dW- 37
Energy a mwo ser

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPs: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/25/08 DAYS: 16

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 10052' Prog: 802 D Hrs: 23 Av RoP: 34.9 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $5,000 TMC: $38,200 TDC: $58,000 CWC: $1,357,950
Contracto : NI BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu d5 TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.6 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 34 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 6/8 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 1/2 SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 10.4 GPM : 350 SIN: 5339 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1290 Jets: 6Xi6 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 4.6 AV Dc: 295.8 To out: IN HOLE Tee/Rods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT Û AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 7954 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 7.9 Jetvel: 78 FTG: 2098 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.70 ECD: 9.8 Hrs: 56 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 37.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 22,000

ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 28/34 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 5,000
Dap: 4.5 stm.up: 49.2 R-RPM: 10/15 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti Tie Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 56 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 217.5 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 14:30 8.5 DRILL Fl9,250' TO 9,572' ROP = 37.88' Misc.I Labor: $
14:30 15:00 .5 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -

15:00 17:30 2.5 DRILL FI9,572' TO 9,670' ROP = 39.2' Daily Total: $ 58,000

17:30 18:00 0.5 SURVEY @9,527' WAS 3.5 DEGREE Cum, wtr: $ 11,435

18:00 06:00 12 DRILL FI9,670'TO 10,052' ROP = 31.83' Cum. Fuel $ 93,655

RECEIVED cum.sits: $ 42,000
BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

MM .16 STAB 6-1/2 35.57

DIVOFOlL,GAS&MINING PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go STAB 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -5289' Sunnyside 11438' 1386' 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -1444' Kenilworth 11228' 1176'

Lower Masaverd 10128' 76' Aberdeen 11788' 1736'

Castlegate 10968' 916' Spring canyon 11913' 1861' TOTAL BHA = 609.69

Desert 11218' 1166' Mancos 12043' 1991' Survey 9527 3.5

Grassy 11298' 1246' TD 14213' 4161' Survey

PIU 245 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS 475

SIO 220 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 2150

ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET g 3349' PEAK GAS 5337

FUEL Used: 1476 On Hand: 9390 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 4 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFllENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY yyas gigg en

DAILY DRILLING REPORT L 3-dW- 37
Energy a mwo ser

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPs: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/25/08 DAYS: 16

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 10052' Prog: 802 D Hrs: 23 Av RoP: 34.9 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $5,000 TMC: $38,200 TDC: $58,000 CWC: $1,357,950
Contracto : NI BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu d5 TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.6 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 34 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 6/8 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 1/2 SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 10.4 GPM : 350 SIN: 5339 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1290 Jets: 6Xi6 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 4.6 AV Dc: 295.8 To out: IN HOLE Tee/Rods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT Û AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 7954 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 7.9 Jetvel: 78 FTG: 2098 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.70 ECD: 9.8 Hrs: 56 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 37.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 22,000

ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 28/34 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 5,000

Dap: 4.5 stm.up: 49.2 R-RPM: 10/15 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $
Ti Tie Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 56 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 217.5 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 14:30 8.5 DRILL Fl9,250' TO 9,572' ROP = 37.88' Misc.I Labor: $
14:30 15:00 .5 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -

15:00 17:30 2.5 DRILL FI9,572' TO 9,670' ROP = 39.2' Daily Total: $ 58,000

17:30 18:00 0.5 SURVEY @9,527' WAS 3.5 DEGREE Cum, wtr: $ 11,435

18:00 06:00 12 DRILL FI9,670'TO 10,052' ROP = 31.83' Cum. Fuel $ 93,655

RECEIVED cum.sits: $ 42,000
BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

MM .16 STAB 6-1/2 35.57

DIVOFOlL,GAS&MINING PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go STAB 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -5289' Sunnyside 11438' 1386' 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -1444' Kenilworth 11228' 1176'

Lower Masaverd 10128' 76' Aberdeen 11788' 1736'

Castlegate 10968' 916' Spring canyon 11913' 1861' TOTAL BHA = 609.69

Desert 11218' 1166' Mancos 12043' 1991' Survey 9527 3.5

Grassy 11298' 1246' TD 14213' 4161' Survey

PIU 245 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS 475

SIO 220 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 2150

ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET g 3349' PEAK GAS 5337

FUEL Used: 1476 On Hand: 9390 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 4 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONFllENTIAL
GASCO ENERGY yyas gigg en

DAILY DRILLING REPORT L 3-dW- 37
Energy a mwo ser

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPs: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/25/08 DAYS: 16

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 10052' Prog: 802 D Hrs: 23 Av RoP: 34.9 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $5,000 TMC: $38,200 TDC: $58,000 CWC: $1,357,950
Contracto : NI BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu d5 TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.6 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 34 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 6/8 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 1/2 SPM: 100 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 10.4 GPM : 350 SIN: 5339 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1290 Jets: 6Xi6 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 4.6 AV Dc: 295.8 To out: IN HOLE Tee/Rods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT Û AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 7954 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 7.9 Jetvel: 78 FTG: 2098 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.70 ECD: 9.8 Hrs: 56 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 37.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 22,000

ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 28/34 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 5,000

Dap: 4.5 stm.up: 49.2 R-RPM: 10/15 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $
Ti Tie Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 56 Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 217.5 Daily Total: $ Directional tools $
6:00 14:30 8.5 DRILL Fl9,250' TO 9,572' ROP = 37.88' Misc.I Labor: $
14:30 15:00 .5 SERVICE RIG & TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -

15:00 17:30 2.5 DRILL FI9,572' TO 9,670' ROP = 39.2' Daily Total: $ 58,000

17:30 18:00 0.5 SURVEY @9,527' WAS 3.5 DEGREE Cum, wtr: $ 11,435

18:00 06:00 12 DRILL FI9,670'TO 10,052' ROP = 31.83' Cum. Fuel $ 93,655

RECEIVED cum.sits: $ 42,000
BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

MM .16 STAB 6-1/2 35.57

DIVOFOlL,GAS&MINING PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

STAB 7.75 5.70

DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go STAB 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -5289' Sunnyside 11438' 1386' 17 DC 6-1/2 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -1444' Kenilworth 11228' 1176'

Lower Masaverd 10128' 76' Aberdeen 11788' 1736'

Castlegate 10968' 916' Spring canyon 11913' 1861' TOTAL BHA = 609.69

Desert 11218' 1166' Mancos 12043' 1991' Survey 9527 3.5

Grassy 11298' 1246' TD 14213' 4161' Survey

PIU 245 K# LITH: VENT: NO BKG GAS 475

SIO 220 K# FLARE: NO Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 2150

ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET g 3349' PEAK GAS 5337

FUEL Used: 1476 On Hand: 9390 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 4 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP



CONFIDENMGASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRIE

#

OG50EPORT

5
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/28/08 DAYS: 19

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
De th: 11118' Pro : 488 D Hrs: 22 1/2 AV ROP: 21.7 Formation: CASTLEGATEDMpC:

$10,800 TMC: $62,550 TDC: $42,300 CWC: $1,494,600
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.3 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: 5 Conductor: - RAT HOLE $
vis: 36 SPM: Size: 1-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVlYP: 9/11 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 2/4 SPM: 108 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 11.2 GPM : 350 SIN: 5337 Float Equp; $ Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1450 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: - Water: $
Solids: 10 AV Dc: 319.3 TD Out: IN HOLE TBG/Rods: - Fuel: $
MBT 12.5 AV DP: 194.1 Depth In: 10245 Packers: - Casing Crew: $
PH : 8.1 JetVel: 103 FTG: 8Ì3 Tanks: - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 10.57 Hrs: 44 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 19.8 Heater: $ - Bits:

ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 30/36 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $10,800
Dap: 4.25 stm.up: 53.Û R-RPM 50/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 500

Ti lie Break Dawn: Total D.T. IMI-RPM: NONE Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: Û9. Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $
6:00 11:30 5.5 DRILL Fl10,630' TO 10,781' ROP = 27.45' Misc.I Labor: $
11:30 12:00 .5 SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -

12:00 12:30 0.5 ATTEMPT SURVEY WITH PRO DRIFT NOT SUCCESS Daily Total: $ 42,300

12:30 14;30 2 DRILL F/10,781' TO 10,850' ROP = 34.5' Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435

14:30 15:00 0.5 REAM STD & BRING ON TWO PUMPS & TAKE SURVEY@i0,746 WAS 3.7 DEGREE Cum. Fuel $ 93,655
15:00 06:00 15 DRILL Fl10,850' TO 11,118' ROP = 17.86 Cum. Bits: $ 54,000

RECEIVED
¯

BHA
BlT 7-7/8 1.00JIJL28 2008 NBS 7.75 5.75

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52
DIV.0fCIL,GAŒ&MINING

DC 6 1/2 31.34

STAB 7.75 5.72

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go DC 6 1/2 29.35

Wasatch 4763' -6355' Sunnyside 11438' 320' STAB 7 3/4 5.72

Mesaverde 8608' -2510' Kenilworth 11228' 110' 16 DC 6 1/2 492.49

Lower Masaverd 10128' -990' Aberdeen 11788' 670'

Castlegate 10968' -150' Spring canyon 11913' 795' TOTAL BHA = 579.89

Desert 11218' 100' Mancos 12043' 925' Survey 10,746 3.7

Grassy 11298' 180' TD 14213' 3095' Survey

P/U 285 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 4100

SIO 235 K# FLARE: YES 5' TO T Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 4950

ROT. 248 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 7115

FUEL Used: 1342 On Hand: 12731 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
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Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
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Solids: 10 AV Dc: 319.3 TD Out: IN HOLE TBG/Rods: - Fuel: $
MBT 12.5 AV DP: 194.1 Depth In: 10245 Packers: - Casing Crew: $
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Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 19.8 Heater: $ - Bits:

ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 30/36 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $10,800
Dap: 4.25 stm.up: 53.Û R-RPM 50/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 500

Ti lie Break Dawn: Total D.T. IMI-RPM: NONE Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: Û9. Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $
6:00 11:30 5.5 DRILL Fl10,630' TO 10,781' ROP = 27.45' Misc.I Labor: $
11:30 12:00 .5 SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -

12:00 12:30 0.5 ATTEMPT SURVEY WITH PRO DRIFT NOT SUCCESS Daily Total: $ 42,300

12:30 14;30 2 DRILL F/10,781' TO 10,850' ROP = 34.5' Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435

14:30 15:00 0.5 REAM STD & BRING ON TWO PUMPS & TAKE SURVEY@i0,746 WAS 3.7 DEGREE Cum. Fuel $ 93,655
15:00 06:00 15 DRILL Fl10,850' TO 11,118' ROP = 17.86 Cum. Bits: $ 54,000
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De th: 11118' Pro : 488 D Hrs: 22 1/2 AV ROP: 21.7 Formation: CASTLEGATEDMpC:
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PVlYP: 9/11 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 2/4 SPM: 108 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 11.2 GPM : 350 SIN: 5337 Float Equp; $ Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1450 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: - Water: $
Solids: 10 AV Dc: 319.3 TD Out: IN HOLE TBG/Rods: - Fuel: $
MBT 12.5 AV DP: 194.1 Depth In: 10245 Packers: - Casing Crew: $
PH : 8.1 JetVel: 103 FTG: 8Ì3 Tanks: - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 10.57 Hrs: 44 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 19.8 Heater: $ - Bits:

ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 30/36 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $10,800
Dap: 4.25 stm.up: 53.Û R-RPM 50/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 500

Ti lie Break Dawn: Total D.T. IMI-RPM: NONE Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: Û9. Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $
6:00 11:30 5.5 DRILL Fl10,630' TO 10,781' ROP = 27.45' Misc.I Labor: $
11:30 12:00 .5 SERVICE RIG Csg. Crew: $ -

12:00 12:30 0.5 ATTEMPT SURVEY WITH PRO DRIFT NOT SUCCESS Daily Total: $ 42,300

12:30 14;30 2 DRILL F/10,781' TO 10,850' ROP = 34.5' Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435

14:30 15:00 0.5 REAM STD & BRING ON TWO PUMPS & TAKE SURVEY@i0,746 WAS 3.7 DEGREE Cum. Fuel $ 93,655
15:00 06:00 15 DRILL Fl10,850' TO 11,118' ROP = 17.86 Cum. Bits: $ 54,000

RECEIVED
¯

BHA
BlT 7-7/8 1.00JIJL28 2008 NBS 7.75 5.75

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52
DIV.0fCIL,GAŒ&MINING
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Wasatch 4763' -6355' Sunnyside 11438' 320' STAB 7 3/4 5.72
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Lower Masaverd 10128' -990' Aberdeen 11788' 670'

Castlegate 10968' -150' Spring canyon 11913' 795' TOTAL BHA = 579.89

Desert 11218' 100' Mancos 12043' 925' Survey 10,746 3.7

Grassy 11298' 180' TD 14213' 3095' Survey

P/U 285 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 4100

SIO 235 K# FLARE: YES 5' TO T Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 4950

ROT. 248 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 7115

FUEL Used: 1342 On Hand: 12731 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP



CONFilENTlAL
GASCO GASCO ENERGY 'T7¾ Mtd S-tt

DAILY DRILLING REPORT I- 3-d4 Û-3 8 99
Energy vre om

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/29/08 DAYS: 20

Current: Operations: RIH WITH NEW BIT & MOTOR
Depth: 11366' Prog: 247 D Hrs: 15 1/2 AV ROP: 15.9 Formation:

DMC: $9,700 TMC: $72,250 TDC: $72,000 CWC: $1,566,600
contracto: N/BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.5 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 40 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 12/14 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 2/4 SPM: 108 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 10.4 GPM : 373 SIN: 5337 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1200 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 11 AV DC: 313.5 TD Out: 11366 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 30,100

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 190.5 Depth In: 10245 Packers: $ - casingcrew: $
PH : 8.0 Jetvel: 102 FTG: 1121 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 10.83 Hrs: 59.5 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 18.84' Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca: 40 SPR#2: WOB: 34/38 PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $9,700
Dap: 4.5 Btm.Up: 56 R-RPM: 62/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 1,200

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: NONE Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 285.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $
6:00 14:00 8 DRILL F/11,118' TO 11,261' ROP = 17.9' Misc.I Labor: $
14:00 14:30 .5 RIG SERVICE & TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -

14:30 22:00 7.5 DRILL F/11,261' TO 11,366' ROP = 14' Daily Total: $ 72,000

22:00 22:30 0.5 SLUG DRILL PIPE DROP SURVEY TOOL Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435

22:30 04:30 6 POOH & LID BIT NBS & PRO DRIFT TOOL Cum. Fuel $ 123,755

04:30 05:30 1 PULL QWEAR BUSHING OK HAD A LITTLE WEAR SET SAME Cum. Bits: $ 54,000

05:30 06:00 0.5 M/UBIT&MOTOR RECElVED BHA
BIT 7-7/8 1.00

JUL2 9 2008 NBS 7.75 5.75

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

DN.0FOIL,GAS&MINING DC 61/2 31.34

STAB 7.75 5.72

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go DC 6 1/2 29.35

Wasatch 4763' -6603' Sunnyside 11438' 72' STAB 7 3/4 5.72

Mesaverde 8608' -2758' Kenilworth 11228' -138' 16 DC 6 1/2 492.49

Lower Masaverd 10128' -1238' Aberdeen 11788' 422'

Castlegate 10968' -398' Spring canyon 11913' 54T TOTAL BHA = 579.89

Desert 11218' -148' Mancos 12043' 67T Survey 10,746 3.7

Grassy 11298°
-68' TD 14213' 284T Survey

PIU 285 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 3350

SIO 235 K# FLARE: YES 2' TO 3' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 5539

ROT. 248 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 5689

FUEL Used: 1558 On Hand: 11173 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 0 1/2 CT GIS X 1/32 NA
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Energy vre om

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/29/08 DAYS: 20

Current: Operations: RIH WITH NEW BIT & MOTOR
Depth: 11366' Prog: 247 D Hrs: 15 1/2 AV ROP: 15.9 Formation:

DMC: $9,700 TMC: $72,250 TDC: $72,000 CWC: $1,566,600
contracto: N/BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.5 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 40 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVIYP: 12/14 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 2/4 SPM: 108 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 10.4 GPM : 373 SIN: 5337 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $
Cake: 1 Press: 1200 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $
Solids: 11 AV DC: 313.5 TD Out: 11366 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 30,100

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 190.5 Depth In: 10245 Packers: $ - casingcrew: $
PH : 8.0 Jetvel: 102 FTG: 1121 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 10.83 Hrs: 59.5 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 18.84' Heater: $ - Bits: $
ca: 40 SPR#2: WOB: 34/38 PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $9,700
Dap: 4.5 Btm.Up: 56 R-RPM: 62/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ 1,200

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: NONE Misc: Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 285.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $
6:00 14:00 8 DRILL F/11,118' TO 11,261' ROP = 17.9' Misc.I Labor: $
14:00 14:30 .5 RIG SERVICE & TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -

14:30 22:00 7.5 DRILL F/11,261' TO 11,366' ROP = 14' Daily Total: $ 72,000

22:00 22:30 0.5 SLUG DRILL PIPE DROP SURVEY TOOL Cum. Wtr: $ 11,435

22:30 04:30 6 POOH & LID BIT NBS & PRO DRIFT TOOL Cum. Fuel $ 123,755

04:30 05:30 1 PULL QWEAR BUSHING OK HAD A LITTLE WEAR SET SAME Cum. Bits: $ 54,000

05:30 06:00 0.5 M/UBIT&MOTOR RECElVED BHA

BIT 7-7/8 1.00

JUL2 9 2008 NBS 7.75 5.75

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.52

DN.0FOIL,GAS&MINING DC 61/2 31.34

STAB 7.75 5.72

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go DC 6 1/2 29.35

Wasatch 4763' -6603' Sunnyside 11438' 72' STAB 7 3/4 5.72

Mesaverde 8608' -2758' Kenilworth 11228' -138' 16 DC 6 1/2 492.49

Lower Masaverd 10128' -1238' Aberdeen 11788' 422'

Castlegate 10968' -398' Spring canyon 11913' 54T TOTAL BHA = 579.89

Desert 11218' -148' Mancos 12043' 67T Survey 10,746 3.7

Grassy 11298°
-68' TD 14213' 284T Survey

PIU 285 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 3350

SIO 235 K# FLARE: YES 2' TO 3' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 5539

ROT. 248 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 5689

FUEL Used: 1558 On Hand: 11173 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 0 1/2 CT GIS X 1/32 NA
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6:00 14:00 8 DRILL F/11,118' TO 11,261' ROP = 17.9' Misc.I Labor: $
14:00 14:30 .5 RIG SERVICE & TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -
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FUEL Used: 1558 On Hand: 11173 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS NA
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 0 1/2 CT GIS X 1/32 NA



CONFilENTIALGAS00 GASCO ENERGY T^/m A / 5-//

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT S-dVf- 3829(oIl€TLIV emoo se
07 AFE # 60507 GP N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/30/08 DAYS: 21
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11684' Prog: 319 D Hrs: 14 AV ROP: 22.8 Formation: KENILWORTH
DMC: $4,500 TMC: $76,750 TDC: $52,850 CWC: $1,619,450
Contracto : NT 30RS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.6 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 41 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVffP: 14/15 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 2/6 SPM: 101 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 10 GPM : 352 SIN: 5337 5338 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $ 600
Cake: 1 Press: 1560 Jets: 6X16 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 1,750
Solids: 12 AV DC: 313.5 TD Out: 11366 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT 12.5 AV DP: 190.5 Depth In: 10245 11366 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 7.9 Jetvei: 102 FTG: 1121 319 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 10.96 Hrs: 59.5 14 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 18.84' 22.8 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 12,000

ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 34/38 28/34 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $4,500
Dap: 4.5 stm.up: 56.8 R-RPM: 62/68 8/10 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti ne Break D3wn: Total D.T. M-RPM: NONE 56 Misc: Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 299.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $
6:00 07:00 1 PIU BHA & RIH WISAME Misc. / Labor: $1,500
07:00 11:30 4.5 RIH SLOW WELL FLOWING @7,538' Csg. Crew: $ -

11:30 12:30 1 ciRC. ouT GAs Daily Total: $ 52,850

12:30 14:30 2 CONTINUE RIH SLOW cum.wtr: $ 13,185
14:30 15:30 1 WASH & REAM Flii,300' TO 11,365' & BREAK IN BIT Cum. Fuel $ 123,755

15:30 20:30 5 DRILL Fl11,365' TO 11,485' ROP = 24' Cum. Bits: $ 64,000
20:30 21:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE BHA

21:00 06:00 9 DRILL FI11,485' TO 11,684' ROP = 22' BIT 7-7/8 1.00

MOTOR .16
6-1/2 35.58

DIV.DEUIL,GAS&MINING PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

IBS 7.75 5.72

DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go IBS 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -6921' Sunnyside 11438' -246' 17 DC'S 6-1/2" 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -3076' Kenilworth 11228' -456'

Lower Masaverd 10128' -1556' Aberdeen 11788' 104'

Castlegate 10968' -710' Spring canyon 11913' 229' TOTAL BHA = 609.60

Desert 11218' -466' Mancos 12043' 359' Survey 10,746 3.7

Grassy 11298' -386' TD 14213' 2529' Survey 11,582 3.0

PIU 290 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 4063

S/O 235 K# FLARE: YES 5' TO 8' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 5539

ROT. 261 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 8100

FUEL Used: 1485 On Hand: 10562 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS 8100
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O 1/2 CT GIS X 1/32 NA

CONFilENTIAL
GAS00 GASCO ENERGY T^/m A / 5-//

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT S-dVf- 3829(oIl€TLIV emoo se
07 AFE # 60507 GP N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/30/08 DAYS: 21

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11684' Prog: 319 D Hrs: 14 AV ROP: 22.8 Formation: KENILWORTH
DMC: $4,500 TMC: $76,750 TDC: $52,850 CWC: $1,619,450
Contracto : NT 30RS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.6 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 41 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVffP: 14/15 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 2/6 SPM: 101 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 10 GPM : 352 SIN: 5337 5338 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $ 600
Cake: 1 Press: 1560 Jets: 6X16 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 1,750
Solids: 12 AV DC: 313.5 TD Out: 11366 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT 12.5 AV DP: 190.5 Depth In: 10245 11366 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 7.9 Jetvei: 102 FTG: 1121 319 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 10.96 Hrs: 59.5 14 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 18.84' 22.8 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 12,000

ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 34/38 28/34 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $4,500
Dap: 4.5 stm.up: 56.8 R-RPM: 62/68 8/10 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti ne Break D3wn: Total D.T. M-RPM: NONE 56 Misc: Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 299.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $
6:00 07:00 1 PIU BHA & RIH WISAME Misc. / Labor: $1,500
07:00 11:30 4.5 RIH SLOW WELL FLOWING @7,538' Csg. Crew: $ -

11:30 12:30 1 ciRC. ouT GAs Daily Total: $ 52,850

12:30 14:30 2 CONTINUE RIH SLOW cum.wtr: $ 13,185
14:30 15:30 1 WASH & REAM Flii,300' TO 11,365' & BREAK IN BIT Cum. Fuel $ 123,755

15:30 20:30 5 DRILL Fl11,365' TO 11,485' ROP = 24' Cum. Bits: $ 64,000

20:30 21:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE BHA

21:00 06:00 9 DRILL FI11,485' TO 11,684' ROP = 22' BIT 7-7/8 1.00

MOTOR .16
6-1/2 35.58

DIV.DEUIL,GAS&MINING PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

IBS 7.75 5.72

DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go IBS 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -6921' Sunnyside 11438' -246' 17 DC'S 6-1/2" 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -3076' Kenilworth 11228' -456'

Lower Masaverd 10128' -1556' Aberdeen 11788' 104'

Castlegate 10968' -710' Spring canyon 11913' 229' TOTAL BHA = 609.60

Desert 11218' -466' Mancos 12043' 359' Survey 10,746 3.7

Grassy 11298' -386' TD 14213' 2529' Survey 11,582 3.0

PIU 290 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 4063

S/O 235 K# FLARE: YES 5' TO 8' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 5539

ROT. 261 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 8100

FUEL Used: 1485 On Hand: 10562 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS 8100
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O 1/2 CT GIS X 1/32 NA

CONFilENTIAL
GAS00 GASCO ENERGY T^/m A / 5-//

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT S-dVf- 3829(oIl€TLIV emoo se
07 AFE # 60507 GP N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/30/08 DAYS: 21

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 11684' Prog: 319 D Hrs: 14 AV ROP: 22.8 Formation: KENILWORTH
DMC: $4,500 TMC: $76,750 TDC: $52,850 CWC: $1,619,450
Contracto : NT 30RS 99 Mud co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.6 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $
vis: 41 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ Rig Move: $
PVffP: 14/15 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 2/6 SPM: 101 MFG: ULTERRA ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 10 GPM : 352 SIN: 5337 5338 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $ 600
Cake: 1 Press: 1560 Jets: 6X16 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 1,750
Solids: 12 AV DC: 313.5 TD Out: 11366 IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $
MBT 12.5 AV DP: 190.5 Depth In: 10245 11366 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $
PH : 7.9 Jetvei: 102 FTG: 1121 319 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.40 ECD: 10.96 Hrs: 59.5 14 separator: $ - cement: $
Chlor: 17000 SPR #1 : FPH: 18.84' 22.8 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 12,000

ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 34/38 28/34 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $4,500
Dap: 4.5 stm.up: 56.8 R-RPM: 62/68 8/10 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $

Ti ne Break D3wn: Total D.T. M-RPM: NONE 56 Misc: Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 299.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $
6:00 07:00 1 PIU BHA & RIH WISAME Misc. / Labor: $1,500
07:00 11:30 4.5 RIH SLOW WELL FLOWING @7,538' Csg. Crew: $ -

11:30 12:30 1 ciRC. ouT GAs Daily Total: $ 52,850

12:30 14:30 2 CONTINUE RIH SLOW cum.wtr: $ 13,185
14:30 15:30 1 WASH & REAM Flii,300' TO 11,365' & BREAK IN BIT Cum. Fuel $ 123,755

15:30 20:30 5 DRILL Fl11,365' TO 11,485' ROP = 24' Cum. Bits: $ 64,000

20:30 21:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE BHA

21:00 06:00 9 DRILL FI11,485' TO 11,684' ROP = 22' BIT 7-7/8 1.00

MOTOR .16
6-1/2 35.58

DIV.DEUIL,GAS&MINING PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

IBS 7.75 5.72

DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go IBS 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -6921' Sunnyside 11438' -246' 17 DC'S 6-1/2" 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -3076' Kenilworth 11228' -456'

Lower Masaverd 10128' -1556' Aberdeen 11788' 104'

Castlegate 10968' -710' Spring canyon 11913' 229' TOTAL BHA = 609.60

Desert 11218' -466' Mancos 12043' 359' Survey 10,746 3.7

Grassy 11298' -386' TD 14213' 2529' Survey 11,582 3.0

PIU 290 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 4063

S/O 235 K# FLARE: YES 5' TO 8' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 5539

ROT. 261 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 8100

FUEL Used: 1485 On Hand: 10562 Co.Man JIM WEIR TRIP GAS 8100
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O 1/2 CT GIS X 1/32 NA



CONFIDENTIALGAS00 GASCO ENERGY -

DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/ - 3M1(aEnergy w AFE#60507 GPS:39e580 9W 1.
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/31/08 DAYS: 22
Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 12515' Prog: 831 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 35.4 Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $4,347 TMC: $81,097 TDC: $36,847 CWC: $1,656,297
Contractor: Nt BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 6 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 62 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 15/15 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 3/7/ SPM: 64 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: Û GPM : 440 SIN: 5338 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 2300 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 369.8 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 224.5 Depth In: 11366 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 120 FTG: 1149 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.60 ECD: 11.2 Hrs: 37.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 30.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca: 40 SPR#2: WOB: 28/34 PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 4,347
Dap: 4.5 stm.up: 50.2 R-RPM: 40/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 65 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 322.5 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 12:30 6.5 DRLG FR 11681' - 11864' @28'lHR Misc. I Labor: $ -

12:30 13:00 .5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -

13:00 6:00 17 DRLG FR 11864'-12515' @ 38.3•IHR Daily Total: $ 36,847
cum.wtr: $ 13,185
Cum. Fuel $ 123,755

RECEIVED cum.sits: $ 64,000
BHA

JUL ? ? 2008 siT 7-7/8 1.00

MOTOR .16
6-1/2 35.58

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

IBS 7.75 5.72

DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go IBS 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -7752' Sunnyside 11438' -1077' 17 DC'S 6-1/2" 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -3907' Kenilworth 11228' -128T

Lower Masaverd 10128' -238T Aberdeen 11788' -727'

Castlegate 10968' -1547' Spring canyon 11913' -602' TOTAL BHA = 609.50

Desert 11218' -129T Mancos 12043°
-472' Survey 11582 3.0

Grassy 11298' -1217' TD 14213' 1698' Survey 12148 2.0

P/U 301 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAs 1950

S/O 247 K# FLARE: YES 5' TO 8' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 2253

ROT. 271 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 5550

FUEL Used: 2346 On Hand: 8216 Co.Man J.D.Allen TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC BIS G ODC RP

CONDITION O 1/2 CT G/S X 1/32 NA

CONFIDENTIALGAS00 GASCO ENERGY -

DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/ - 3M1(aEnergy w AFE#60507 GPS:39e580 9W 1.
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/31/08 DAYS: 22

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 12515' Prog: 831 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 35.4 Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $4,347 TMC: $81,097 TDC: $36,847 CWC: $1,656,297
Contractor: Nt BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 6 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 62 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 15/15 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 3/7/ SPM: 64 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: Û GPM : 440 SIN: 5338 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 2300 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 369.8 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 224.5 Depth In: 11366 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 120 FTG: 1149 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.60 ECD: 11.2 Hrs: 37.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 30.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca: 40 SPR#2: WOB: 28/34 PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 4,347
Dap: 4.5 stm.up: 50.2 R-RPM: 40/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 65 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 322.5 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 12:30 6.5 DRLG FR 11681' - 11864' @28'lHR Misc. I Labor: $ -

12:30 13:00 .5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -

13:00 6:00 17 DRLG FR 11864'-12515' @ 38.3•IHR Daily Total: $ 36,847
cum.wtr: $ 13,185
Cum. Fuel $ 123,755

RECEIVED cum.sits: $ 64,000
BHA

JUL ? ? 2008 siT 7-7/8 1.00

MOTOR .16
6-1/2 35.58

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

IBS 7.75 5.72

DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go IBS 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -7752' Sunnyside 11438' -1077' 17 DC'S 6-1/2" 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -3907' Kenilworth 11228' -128T

Lower Masaverd 10128' -238T Aberdeen 11788' -727'

Castlegate 10968' -1547' Spring canyon 11913' -602' TOTAL BHA = 609.50

Desert 11218' -129T Mancos 12043°
-472' Survey 11582 3.0

Grassy 11298' -1217' TD 14213' 1698' Survey 12148 2.0

P/U 301 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAs 1950

S/O 247 K# FLARE: YES 5' TO 8' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 2253

ROT. 271 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 5550

FUEL Used: 2346 On Hand: 8216 Co.Man J.D.Allen TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC BIS G ODC RP

CONDITION O 1/2 CT G/S X 1/32 NA

CONFIDENTIALGAS00 GASCO ENERGY -

DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/ - 3M1(aEnergy w AFE#60507 GPS:39e580 9W 1.
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 7/31/08 DAYS: 22

Current: Operations: DRILLING AHEAD
Depth: 12515' Prog: 831 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 35.4 Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $4,347 TMC: $81,097 TDC: $36,847 CWC: $1,656,297
Contractor: Nt BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 6 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 62 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 15/15 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 3/7/ SPM: 64 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: Û GPM : 440 SIN: 5338 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 2300 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 369.8 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 224.5 Depth In: 11366 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 120 FTG: 1149 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.60 ECD: 11.2 Hrs: 37.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 30.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca: 40 SPR#2: WOB: 28/34 PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 4,347
Dap: 4.5 stm.up: 50.2 R-RPM: 40/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 65 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 3,000
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 322.5 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 12:30 6.5 DRLG FR 11681' - 11864' @28'lHR Misc. I Labor: $ -

12:30 13:00 .5 RIG SERVICE - SERVICE TOP DRIVE Csg. Crew: $ -

13:00 6:00 17 DRLG FR 11864'-12515' @ 38.3•IHR Daily Total: $ 36,847
cum.wtr: $ 13,185
Cum. Fuel $ 123,755

RECEIVED cum.sits: $ 64,000
BHA

JUL ? ? 2008 siT 7-7/8 1.00

MOTOR .16
6-1/2 35.58

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

IBS 7.75 5.72

DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go IBS 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -7752' Sunnyside 11438' -1077' 17 DC'S 6-1/2" 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -3907' Kenilworth 11228' -128T

Lower Masaverd 10128' -238T Aberdeen 11788' -727'

Castlegate 10968' -1547' Spring canyon 11913' -602' TOTAL BHA = 609.50

Desert 11218' -129T Mancos 12043°
-472' Survey 11582 3.0

Grassy 11298' -1217' TD 14213' 1698' Survey 12148 2.0

P/U 301 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAs 1950

S/O 247 K# FLARE: YES 5' TO 8' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 2253

ROT. 271 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 5550

FUEL Used: 2346 On Hand: 8216 Co.Man J.D.Allen TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC BIS G ODC RP

CONDITION O 1/2 CT G/S X 1/32 NA



CONFllENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY yyas y s-a
DAILY DRILLING REPORT 2-oV 3 M ¾Energy t ra no

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/1/08 DAYS: 23
Current: Operations: T.O.O.H. FOR BIT
Depth: 12900' Prog: 385 D Hrs: 18 1/2 AV ROP: 20.8 Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $6,408 TMC: $87,505 TDC: $48,624 CWC: $1,704,921
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drig. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11.8 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: 6 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 46 SPM: 66 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig move: $ -

PVIYP: 16/16 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 7/12/ SPM: 65 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 10 GPM : 457 SIN: 5338 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 2575 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 13 AV DC: 384 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 233.5 Depth In: 11366 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvel: 124 FTG: 1534 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.10 ECD: 11.73 Hrs: 56 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 16000 SPR #1 : FPH: 27.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 18/28 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 6,408
Dap: 4.4 Btm.Up: 52 R-RPM: 40/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Time Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 65 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 341.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ 4,500
6:00 0:30 18.5 DRLG FR 12515' - 12900' @21'IHR Misc. I Labor: $ 6,716
0:30 1:00 .5 SPOT 75BBLS OF 13.8ppg MUD FROM 12900'- 11690' Csg. Crew: $ -

1:00 3:00 2 T.o.o.H.15stds & PUMP DRY JOB PILL Daily Total: $ 48,624

3:00 3:30 0.5 PULL ROT. HEAD RUBBER Cum. Wtr: $ 13,185

3:30 6:00 2.5 T.O.O.H. FOR BIT cum.Fuel $ 123,755
cum.Bits: $ 64,000

BHA

flECEIVED "'' "' '°°

MOTOR .16
6-1/2 35.58

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

IBS 7.75 5.72

DIVDFnll n ¡¡Aly; DAYLIGHTS SHORT ONE FLOORHAND DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go IBS 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -8137' Sunnyside 11438' -1462' 17 DC'S 6-1/2" 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -4292' Kenilworth 11228' -1672'

Lower Masaverd 10128' -2772' Aberdeen 11788' -1112'

Castlegate 10968' -1932' Spring canyon 11913' -987' TOTAL BHA = 609.50

Desert 11218' -1682' Mancos 12043' -857' Survey 12148 2.0

Grassy 11298' -1602' TD 14213' 1313' Survey 12683 2.8

P/U 310 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2375

SIO 250 K# FLARE: 3'-8' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 5125

ROT. 274 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 5125

FUEL Used: - On Hand: 8856 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O 1/2 CT G/S X 1/32 NA

CONFllENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY yyas y s-a
DAILY DRILLING REPORT 2-oV 3 M ¾Energy t ra no

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/1/08 DAYS: 23
Current: Operations: T.O.O.H. FOR BIT
Depth: 12900' Prog: 385 D Hrs: 18 1/2 AV ROP: 20.8 Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $6,408 TMC: $87,505 TDC: $48,624 CWC: $1,704,921
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drig. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11.8 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: 6 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 46 SPM: 66 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig move: $ -

PVIYP: 16/16 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 7/12/ SPM: 65 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 10 GPM : 457 SIN: 5338 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 2575 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 13 AV DC: 384 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 233.5 Depth In: 11366 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvel: 124 FTG: 1534 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.10 ECD: 11.73 Hrs: 56 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 16000 SPR #1 : FPH: 27.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 18/28 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 6,408
Dap: 4.4 Btm.Up: 52 R-RPM: 40/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Time Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 65 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 341.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ 4,500
6:00 0:30 18.5 DRLG FR 12515' - 12900' @21'IHR Misc. I Labor: $ 6,716
0:30 1:00 .5 SPOT 75BBLS OF 13.8ppg MUD FROM 12900'- 11690' Csg. Crew: $ -

1:00 3:00 2 T.o.o.H.15stds & PUMP DRY JOB PILL Daily Total: $ 48,624

3:00 3:30 0.5 PULL ROT. HEAD RUBBER Cum. Wtr: $ 13,185

3:30 6:00 2.5 T.O.O.H. FOR BIT cum.Fuel $ 123,755

cum.Bits: $ 64,000
BHA

flECEIVED "'' "' '°°

MOTOR .16
6-1/2 35.58

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

IBS 7.75 5.72

DIVDFnll n ¡¡Aly; DAYLIGHTS SHORT ONE FLOORHAND DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go IBS 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -8137' Sunnyside 11438' -1462' 17 DC'S 6-1/2" 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -4292' Kenilworth 11228' -1672'

Lower Masaverd 10128' -2772' Aberdeen 11788' -1112'

Castlegate 10968' -1932' Spring canyon 11913' -987' TOTAL BHA = 609.50

Desert 11218' -1682' Mancos 12043' -857' Survey 12148 2.0

Grassy 11298' -1602' TD 14213' 1313' Survey 12683 2.8

P/U 310 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2375

SIO 250 K# FLARE: 3'-8' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 5125

ROT. 274 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 5125

FUEL Used: - On Hand: 8856 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O 1/2 CT G/S X 1/32 NA

CONFllENTIALGASCO GASCO ENERGY yyas y s-a
DAILY DRILLING REPORT 2-oV 3 M ¾Energy t ra no

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/1/08 DAYS: 23
Current: Operations: T.O.O.H. FOR BIT
Depth: 12900' Prog: 385 D Hrs: 18 1/2 AV ROP: 20.8 Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $6,408 TMC: $87,505 TDC: $48,624 CWC: $1,704,921
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drig. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 11.8 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: 6 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 46 SPM: 66 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig move: $ -

PVIYP: 16/16 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 1666D int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 7/12/ SPM: 65 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 10 GPM : 457 SIN: 5338 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 2575 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 13 AV DC: 384 TD Out: IN HOLE TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 233.5 Depth In: 11366 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvel: 124 FTG: 1534 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.10 ECD: 11.73 Hrs: 56 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 16000 SPR #1 : FPH: 27.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 18/28 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 6,408
Dap: 4.4 Btm.Up: 52 R-RPM: 40/60 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Time Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 65 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 25 Total Rot. Hrs: 341.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ 4,500
6:00 0:30 18.5 DRLG FR 12515' - 12900' @21'IHR Misc. I Labor: $ 6,716
0:30 1:00 .5 SPOT 75BBLS OF 13.8ppg MUD FROM 12900'- 11690' Csg. Crew: $ -

1:00 3:00 2 T.o.o.H.15stds & PUMP DRY JOB PILL Daily Total: $ 48,624

3:00 3:30 0.5 PULL ROT. HEAD RUBBER Cum. Wtr: $ 13,185

3:30 6:00 2.5 T.O.O.H. FOR BIT cum.Fuel $ 123,755

cum.Bits: $ 64,000
BHA

flECEIVED "'' "' '°°

MOTOR .16
6-1/2 35.58

PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

IBS 7.75 5.72

DIVDFnll n ¡¡Aly; DAYLIGHTS SHORT ONE FLOORHAND DC 6-1/2 31.34

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go IBS 7 3/4 5.72

Wasatch 4763' -8137' Sunnyside 11438' -1462' 17 DC'S 6-1/2" 521.84

Mesaverde 8608' -4292' Kenilworth 11228' -1672'

Lower Masaverd 10128' -2772' Aberdeen 11788' -1112'

Castlegate 10968' -1932' Spring canyon 11913' -987' TOTAL BHA = 609.50

Desert 11218' -1682' Mancos 12043' -857' Survey 12148 2.0

Grassy 11298' -1602' TD 14213' 1313' Survey 12683 2.8

P/U 310 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2375

SIO 250 K# FLARE: 3'-8' Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS 5125

ROT. 274 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 5125

FUEL Used: - On Hand: 8856 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS N/A
BIT# 5 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O 1/2 CT G/S X 1/32 NA



CONFIDENTig.GASCO GASCO ENERGY x my my
DAILY DRILLING REPORT geqr g<ggE

AFE # 60507 GPS: 9 58.00 109W 51. 8
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/4/08 DAYS: 26
Current: Operations: LOGGING WITH BAKER ATLAS
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIV/0! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $5,256 TMC: $101,225 TDC: $48,160 CWC: $1,873,339
Contracto : NI 30RS 99 Mud Co: M-I DrIg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 101 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/18 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 16400D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 16/23/ SPM: 0 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: 5470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 20 AV DC: 295.8 TD Out: 14245 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 12900 Packers: $ - casingcrew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvel: 96 FTG: 1345 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: 29 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 46.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 12,000
ca: 40 sen#2: wos: 16/20 PumpingL/T: $ - DrillingMud: $ 5,160
Dap: 4.2 Btm.Up: 76 R-RPM: 55/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break D3wn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 83/99 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:30 2.5 SHORT TRIP OUT TO 12045' - 20K DRAG OFF BTM - NO FILL Misc. I Labor: $ -

8:30 11:00 2.5 CIRC. GAS OUT - PEAK GAS 6000units 10' FALRE - BUILD 180BBLS OF 14ppg MUD Csg. Crew: $ -

11:00 11:30 0.5 PUMP 146bbis 14ppg MUD - DISP. 73bbis INTO ANNULUS Daily Total: $ 48,160

11:30 12:30 1 T.O.O.H. TO 13145' Cum. Wtr: $ 13,185
12:30 13:00 0.5 DISPLACE ANOTHER 73bbis OF 14ppg MUD INTO ANNULUS Cum. Fuel $ 160,393
13:00 14:00 1 T.O.O.H. TO 11900· Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

14:00 14:30 0.5 PUMP DRY JOB PILL BHA

14:30 20:30 6 T.O.O.H. FOR LOGS- PULL ROTATING HEAD BIT 7-7/8 1.00

20:30 21:00 0.5 SAFETY MEETING WITH BAKER ATLAS MOTOR.22 6-1/2 33.09

21:00 6:00 9 RIG UP LOGGING TOOLS AND R.I.H. WITH 1ST LOGGING RUN - LOGGERS TD 14252' PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

18 DC'S 6 1/2 553.18

NOFI ÆD Depth FeetTo Go Depih FeetTo Go

Wasatch 4763' -9482' Sunnyside 11438' -2807

Mesaverde 8608' -5637 Kenilworth 11228' -301T

Lower Masaverd 10128' -411T Aberdeen 11788' •245T
MV.O 96 Mi &UNNGCastlegate 10968' -3277' Spring canyon 11913' -2332· TOTAL BHA = 595.57

Desert 11218' -3027' Mancos 12043' -2202' Surveg 13337 2.5

Grassy 11298' -2947' TD 14245• 0' Survey 14242 2.1

P/U 315 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2000

SIO 250 K# FLARE: 10' FLARE ON BTMS UP Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS N/A

ROT. 285 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 6000

FUEL Used: 1968 On Hand: 11603 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS 6000
BIT# 6 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O ' BU A X IN -

CONFIDENTig.GASCO GASCO ENERGY x my my
DAILY DRILLING REPORT geqr g<ggE

AFE # 60507 GPS: 9 58.00 109W 51. 8
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/4/08 DAYS: 26
Current: Operations: LOGGING WITH BAKER ATLAS
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIV/0! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $5,256 TMC: $101,225 TDC: $48,160 CWC: $1,873,339
Contracto : NI 30RS 99 Mud Co: M-I DrIg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 101 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/18 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 16400D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 16/23/ SPM: 0 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: 5470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 20 AV DC: 295.8 TD Out: 14245 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 12900 Packers: $ - casingcrew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvel: 96 FTG: 1345 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: 29 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 46.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 12,000
ca: 40 sen#2: wos: 16/20 PumpingL/T: $ - DrillingMud: $ 5,160
Dap: 4.2 Btm.Up: 76 R-RPM: 55/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break D3wn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 83/99 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:30 2.5 SHORT TRIP OUT TO 12045' - 20K DRAG OFF BTM - NO FILL Misc. I Labor: $ -

8:30 11:00 2.5 CIRC. GAS OUT - PEAK GAS 6000units 10' FALRE - BUILD 180BBLS OF 14ppg MUD Csg. Crew: $ -

11:00 11:30 0.5 PUMP 146bbis 14ppg MUD - DISP. 73bbis INTO ANNULUS Daily Total: $ 48,160

11:30 12:30 1 T.O.O.H. TO 13145' Cum. Wtr: $ 13,185
12:30 13:00 0.5 DISPLACE ANOTHER 73bbis OF 14ppg MUD INTO ANNULUS Cum. Fuel $ 160,393
13:00 14:00 1 T.O.O.H. TO 11900· Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

14:00 14:30 0.5 PUMP DRY JOB PILL BHA

14:30 20:30 6 T.O.O.H. FOR LOGS- PULL ROTATING HEAD BIT 7-7/8 1.00

20:30 21:00 0.5 SAFETY MEETING WITH BAKER ATLAS MOTOR.22 6-1/2 33.09

21:00 6:00 9 RIG UP LOGGING TOOLS AND R.I.H. WITH 1ST LOGGING RUN - LOGGERS TD 14252' PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

18 DC'S 6 1/2 553.18

NOFI ÆD Depth FeetTo Go Depih FeetTo Go

Wasatch 4763' -9482' Sunnyside 11438' -2807

Mesaverde 8608' -5637 Kenilworth 11228' -301T

Lower Masaverd 10128' -411T Aberdeen 11788' •245T
MV.O 96 Mi &UNNGCastlegate 10968' -3277' Spring canyon 11913' -2332· TOTAL BHA = 595.57

Desert 11218' -3027' Mancos 12043' -2202' Surveg 13337 2.5

Grassy 11298' -2947' TD 14245• 0' Survey 14242 2.1

P/U 315 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2000

SIO 250 K# FLARE: 10' FLARE ON BTMS UP Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS N/A

ROT. 285 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 6000

FUEL Used: 1968 On Hand: 11603 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS 6000
BIT# 6 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O ' BU A X IN -

CONFIDENTig.GASCO GASCO ENERGY x my my
DAILY DRILLING REPORT geqr g<ggE

AFE # 60507 GPS: 9 58.00 109W 51. 8
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/4/08 DAYS: 26
Current: Operations: LOGGING WITH BAKER ATLAS
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIV/0! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $5,256 TMC: $101,225 TDC: $48,160 CWC: $1,873,339
Contracto : NI 30RS 99 Mud Co: M-I DrIg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 101 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/18 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: MS 16400D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 16/23/ SPM: 0 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: 5470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 20 AV DC: 295.8 TD Out: 14245 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 12900 Packers: $ - casingcrew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvel: 96 FTG: 1345 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: 29 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 46.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 12,000
ca: 40 sen#2: wos: 16/20 PumpingL/T: $ - DrillingMud: $ 5,160
Dap: 4.2 Btm.Up: 76 R-RPM: 55/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break D3wn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 83/99 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:30 2.5 SHORT TRIP OUT TO 12045' - 20K DRAG OFF BTM - NO FILL Misc. I Labor: $ -

8:30 11:00 2.5 CIRC. GAS OUT - PEAK GAS 6000units 10' FALRE - BUILD 180BBLS OF 14ppg MUD Csg. Crew: $ -

11:00 11:30 0.5 PUMP 146bbis 14ppg MUD - DISP. 73bbis INTO ANNULUS Daily Total: $ 48,160

11:30 12:30 1 T.O.O.H. TO 13145' Cum. Wtr: $ 13,185
12:30 13:00 0.5 DISPLACE ANOTHER 73bbis OF 14ppg MUD INTO ANNULUS Cum. Fuel $ 160,393
13:00 14:00 1 T.O.O.H. TO 11900· Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

14:00 14:30 0.5 PUMP DRY JOB PILL BHA

14:30 20:30 6 T.O.O.H. FOR LOGS- PULL ROTATING HEAD BIT 7-7/8 1.00

20:30 21:00 0.5 SAFETY MEETING WITH BAKER ATLAS MOTOR.22 6-1/2 33.09

21:00 6:00 9 RIG UP LOGGING TOOLS AND R.I.H. WITH 1ST LOGGING RUN - LOGGERS TD 14252' PRO DRIFT 6-1/2 8.30

18 DC'S 6 1/2 553.18

NOFI ÆD Depth FeetTo Go Depih FeetTo Go

Wasatch 4763' -9482' Sunnyside 11438' -2807

Mesaverde 8608' -5637 Kenilworth 11228' -301T

Lower Masaverd 10128' -411T Aberdeen 11788' •245T
MV.O 96 Mi &UNNGCastlegate 10968' -3277' Spring canyon 11913' -2332· TOTAL BHA = 595.57

Desert 11218' -3027' Mancos 12043' -2202' Surveg 13337 2.5

Grassy 11298' -2947' TD 14245• 0' Survey 14242 2.1

P/U 315 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2000

SIO 250 K# FLARE: 10' FLARE ON BTMS UP Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS N/A

ROT. 285 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 6000

FUEL Used: 1968 On Hand: 11603 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS 6000
BIT# 6 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O ' BU A X IN -



CONFilENTIAL
GASCO GASCO ENERGY

DAILYDRILLING REPORT /1/§ 20 pp gEnergy
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/5/08 DAYS: 27
Current: Operations: T.I.H.
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: O AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $7,901 TMC: $114,286 TDC: $92,172 CWC: $1,965,511
Contracto : NTBORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drig. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

VIS: 48 SPM: 101 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PviyP: 18/18 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 16400D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 14/22/ SPM: 0 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: 5470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ 17,488 water: $ -

Solids: 19 AV DC: 295.8 TD Out: 14245 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 12900 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvel: 96 FTG: 1345 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 35,783
PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: 29 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 46.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 16/20 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 7,901
Dap: 4.2 stm.up: 76 R-RPM: 55/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 83/99 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 17:00 11.5 WIRELINE LOGS - RIG DOWN MINI SLAM, PIU & RUN STAR IMAGER LOG FR 14265'-12000' Misc. / Labor: $ -

17:30 23:30 6 WIRELINE LOGS - RIG DOWN STAR IMAGER LOG, PIU & RUN LATEROL LOG DUE TO HIGH CLORIDES IN Csg. Crew: $ -

THE MUD SYSTEM GIVING A LOW RESESTIVITY READING ON THE MINI SLAM FR 14260'- CSG SHOE Daily Total: $ 74,684

23:30 0 0.5 RIG DOWN BAKER ATLAS Cum. Wtr: $ 13,185
0 2:30 2.5 MIU BIT & BIT SUB - R.I.H. WITH BHA & DP. TO CSG SHOE Cum. Fuel $ 160,393

2:30 3:00 0.5 FILL PIPE - MONITER WELL FOR FLOW Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

3:00 4:00 1 SLIP&CUTDRLGLINE RECEIVH.; BHA

4:00 6:00 2 T.I.H. AUG05 2008 "" "'" '°°

BIT SUB 6-1/2 33.09

-;

18 DC'S 6 1/2 553.18

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go

Wasatch 4763' -9482' Sunnyside 11438' -2807'

Mesaverde 8608' -5637' Kenilworth 11228' -3017'

Lower Masaverd 10128' -4117' Aberdeen 11788' -2457'

Castlegate 10968' -3277' Spring canyon 11913' -2332' TOTAL BHA = 587.27

Desert 11218' -3027' Mancos 12043' -2202· Survey 13337 2.5

Grassy 11298' -2947' TD 14245' O' Survey 14242 2.1

PIU 315 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS

S/O 250 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS

ROT. 285 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1788 On Hand: 9815 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS
BIT# 6 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 0 0 BU A X IN -

CONFilENTIAL
GASCO GASCO ENERGY

DAILYDRILLING REPORT /1/§ 20 pp gEnergy
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/5/08 DAYS: 27

Current: Operations: T.I.H.
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: O AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $7,901 TMC: $114,286 TDC: $92,172 CWC: $1,965,511
Contracto : NTBORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drig. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

VIS: 48 SPM: 101 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PviyP: 18/18 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 16400D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000

Gel: 14/22/ SPM: 0 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: 5470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ 17,488 water: $ -

Solids: 19 AV DC: 295.8 TD Out: 14245 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 12900 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvel: 96 FTG: 1345 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 35,783
PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: 29 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 46.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 16/20 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 7,901
Dap: 4.2 stm.up: 76 R-RPM: 55/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 83/99 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 17:00 11.5 WIRELINE LOGS - RIG DOWN MINI SLAM, PIU & RUN STAR IMAGER LOG FR 14265'-12000' Misc. / Labor: $ -

17:30 23:30 6 WIRELINE LOGS - RIG DOWN STAR IMAGER LOG, PIU & RUN LATEROL LOG DUE TO HIGH CLORIDES IN Csg. Crew: $ -

THE MUD SYSTEM GIVING A LOW RESESTIVITY READING ON THE MINI SLAM FR 14260'- CSG SHOE Daily Total: $ 74,684

23:30 0 0.5 RIG DOWN BAKER ATLAS Cum. Wtr: $ 13,185
0 2:30 2.5 MIU BIT & BIT SUB - R.I.H. WITH BHA & DP. TO CSG SHOE Cum. Fuel $ 160,393

2:30 3:00 0.5 FILL PIPE - MONITER WELL FOR FLOW Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

3:00 4:00 1 SLIP&CUTDRLGLINE RECEIVH.; BHA

4:00 6:00 2 T.I.H. AUG05 2008 "" "'" '°°

BIT SUB 6-1/2 33.09

-;

18 DC'S 6 1/2 553.18

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go

Wasatch 4763' -9482' Sunnyside 11438' -2807'

Mesaverde 8608' -5637' Kenilworth 11228' -3017'

Lower Masaverd 10128' -4117' Aberdeen 11788' -2457'

Castlegate 10968' -3277' Spring canyon 11913' -2332' TOTAL BHA = 587.27

Desert 11218' -3027' Mancos 12043' -2202· Survey 13337 2.5

Grassy 11298' -2947' TD 14245' O' Survey 14242 2.1

PIU 315 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS

S/O 250 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS

ROT. 285 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1788 On Hand: 9815 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS
BIT# 6 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 0 0 BU A X IN -

CONFilENTIAL
GASCO GASCO ENERGY

DAILYDRILLING REPORT /1/§ 20 pp gEnergy
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/5/08 DAYS: 27

Current: Operations: T.I.H.
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: O AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $7,901 TMC: $114,286 TDC: $92,172 CWC: $1,965,511
Contracto : NTBORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drig. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

VIS: 48 SPM: 101 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PviyP: 18/18 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 16400D Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000

Gel: 14/22/ SPM: 0 MFG: ULTERRA Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: 5470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ 17,488 water: $ -

Solids: 19 AV DC: 295.8 TD Out: 14245 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 12900 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvel: 96 FTG: 1345 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 35,783
PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: 29 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 46.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 40 SPR#2: WOB: 16/20 Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 7,901
Dap: 4.2 stm.up: 76 R-RPM: 55/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 83/99 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 17:00 11.5 WIRELINE LOGS - RIG DOWN MINI SLAM, PIU & RUN STAR IMAGER LOG FR 14265'-12000' Misc. / Labor: $ -

17:30 23:30 6 WIRELINE LOGS - RIG DOWN STAR IMAGER LOG, PIU & RUN LATEROL LOG DUE TO HIGH CLORIDES IN Csg. Crew: $ -

THE MUD SYSTEM GIVING A LOW RESESTIVITY READING ON THE MINI SLAM FR 14260'- CSG SHOE Daily Total: $ 74,684

23:30 0 0.5 RIG DOWN BAKER ATLAS Cum. Wtr: $ 13,185
0 2:30 2.5 MIU BIT & BIT SUB - R.I.H. WITH BHA & DP. TO CSG SHOE Cum. Fuel $ 160,393

2:30 3:00 0.5 FILL PIPE - MONITER WELL FOR FLOW Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

3:00 4:00 1 SLIP&CUTDRLGLINE RECEIVH.; BHA

4:00 6:00 2 T.I.H. AUG05 2008 "" "'" '°°

BIT SUB 6-1/2 33.09

-;

18 DC'S 6 1/2 553.18

Depth Feet To Go Depth Feet To Go

Wasatch 4763' -9482' Sunnyside 11438' -2807'

Mesaverde 8608' -5637' Kenilworth 11228' -3017'

Lower Masaverd 10128' -4117' Aberdeen 11788' -2457'

Castlegate 10968' -3277' Spring canyon 11913' -2332' TOTAL BHA = 587.27

Desert 11218' -3027' Mancos 12043' -2202· Survey 13337 2.5

Grassy 11298' -2947' TD 14245' O' Survey 14242 2.1

PIU 315 K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS

S/O 250 K# FLARE: Gas Buster: NO CONN GAS

ROT. 285 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 1788 On Hand: 9815 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS
BIT# 6 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 0 0 BU A X IN -



CONFIDENR
GASA GASCO ENERGY " If /

DAILY DRILLINGREPORTEnergy
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/6/08 DAYS: 28

Current: Operations: L.D.D.P.
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS

DMC: $0 TMC: $114,286 TDC: $33,860 CWC: $1,999,371
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 7 8 conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 48 SPM: 101 size: 7-7/8" 7 7/8 surt.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/1Û #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 16400D RR int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000

Gel: 14/22/ SPM: 0 MFG: ULTERRA TRI CONE Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: 5470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: 6X16 OPEN Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,860

Solids: 19 AV DC: 295.8 TD Out: 14245 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 12900 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvei: 96 FTG: 1345 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: 29 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 46.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 16/20 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Dap: 4.2 stm.up: 76 R-RPM: 55/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 83/99 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:30 2.5 T.I.H. TO 10570' - INSTALL ROTATING HEAD Misc.I Labor: $ -

8:30 10:00 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT -25'-30' FLARE PEAK GAS 9500units Csg. Crew: $ -

10:00 11:30 1.5 T.i.H. TO 13000• Daily Total: $ 33,860

11:30 13:00 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT -15-25' FLARE PEAK GAS 7600units Cum. Wtr: $ 20,745

13:00 13:30 0.5 T.I.H. TO 14100' Cum. Fuel $ 160,393

13:30 14:00 0.5 WASH & REAM FR 14100' - 14245' - NO FILL Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

14:00 16:00 2 CIRC. GAS OUT - 5'-10' FLARE PEAK GAS 3780units BHA

16:00 17:00 1 PUMP 146bbis 14ppg MUD & DISP 73bbis INTO ANNULUS BIT 7-7/8 1.00

17:00 17:30 0.5 T.O.O.H. 12stds BIT SUB 6-1/2 3.03

17:30 18:00 0.5 DISP. ANOTHER 73bbis INTO ANNULUS 18 DC'S 6 1/2 553.18

18:00 18:30 0.5 T.O.O.H. 13stds

18:30 19:00 0.5 P

19:00 4:00 9 L.D.D.P.

4:00 5:00 1 T.I.H. 25stds OUT OF DERRICK

5:00 6:00 1 L.D.D.P.

DIV.0F0]LGAS&MINING
TOTAL BHA = 567.21

Survey 13337 2.5

NOTIFIED JAMIE SPARGER WITH BLM ON UPCOMING CASING & CEMENT JOB 8/5/08 Survey 14242 2.1

PIU K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2000

SIO K# FLARE: 5'- 30' ON BTMS UP Gas Buster: YES CONN GAS NA

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET g 3349' PEAK GAS 9500

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8897 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS 3780-9500

BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O BU A X IN -

CONFIDENR
GASA GASCO ENERGY " If /

DAILY DRILLINGREPORTEnergy
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/6/08 DAYS: 28

Current: Operations: L.D.D.P.
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS

DMC: $0 TMC: $114,286 TDC: $33,860 CWC: $1,999,371
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 7 8 conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 48 SPM: 101 size: 7-7/8" 7 7/8 surt.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/1Û #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 16400D RR int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000

Gel: 14/22/ SPM: 0 MFG: ULTERRA TRI CONE Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: 5470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: 6X16 OPEN Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,860

Solids: 19 AV DC: 295.8 TD Out: 14245 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 12900 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvei: 96 FTG: 1345 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: 29 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 46.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 16/20 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Dap: 4.2 stm.up: 76 R-RPM: 55/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 83/99 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:30 2.5 T.I.H. TO 10570' - INSTALL ROTATING HEAD Misc.I Labor: $ -

8:30 10:00 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT -25'-30' FLARE PEAK GAS 9500units Csg. Crew: $ -

10:00 11:30 1.5 T.i.H. TO 13000• Daily Total: $ 33,860

11:30 13:00 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT -15-25' FLARE PEAK GAS 7600units Cum. Wtr: $ 20,745

13:00 13:30 0.5 T.I.H. TO 14100' Cum. Fuel $ 160,393

13:30 14:00 0.5 WASH & REAM FR 14100' - 14245' - NO FILL Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

14:00 16:00 2 CIRC. GAS OUT - 5'-10' FLARE PEAK GAS 3780units BHA

16:00 17:00 1 PUMP 146bbis 14ppg MUD & DISP 73bbis INTO ANNULUS BIT 7-7/8 1.00

17:00 17:30 0.5 T.O.O.H. 12stds BIT SUB 6-1/2 3.03

17:30 18:00 0.5 DISP. ANOTHER 73bbis INTO ANNULUS 18 DC'S 6 1/2 553.18

18:00 18:30 0.5 T.O.O.H. 13stds

18:30 19:00 0.5 P

19:00 4:00 9 L.D.D.P.

4:00 5:00 1 T.I.H. 25stds OUT OF DERRICK

5:00 6:00 1 L.D.D.P.

DIV.0F0]LGAS&MINING
TOTAL BHA = 567.21

Survey 13337 2.5

NOTIFIED JAMIE SPARGER WITH BLM ON UPCOMING CASING & CEMENT JOB 8/5/08 Survey 14242 2.1

PIU K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2000

SIO K# FLARE: 5'- 30' ON BTMS UP Gas Buster: YES CONN GAS NA

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET g 3349' PEAK GAS 9500

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8897 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS 3780-9500

BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O BU A X IN -

CONFIDENR
GASA GASCO ENERGY " If /

DAILY DRILLINGREPORTEnergy
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/6/08 DAYS: 28

Current: Operations: L.D.D.P.
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS

DMC: $0 TMC: $114,286 TDC: $33,860 CWC: $1,999,371
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: 7 8 conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 48 SPM: 101 size: 7-7/8" 7 7/8 surt.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/1Û #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: MS 16400D RR int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000

Gel: 14/22/ SPM: 0 MFG: ULTERRA TRI CONE Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: 5470 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: 6X16 OPEN Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,860

Solids: 19 AV DC: 295.8 TD Out: 14245 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: 12900 Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvei: 96 FTG: 1345 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: 29 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: 46.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: 16/20 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Dap: 4.2 stm.up: 76 R-RPM: 55/68 Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 83/99 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:30 2.5 T.I.H. TO 10570' - INSTALL ROTATING HEAD Misc.I Labor: $ -

8:30 10:00 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT -25'-30' FLARE PEAK GAS 9500units Csg. Crew: $ -

10:00 11:30 1.5 T.i.H. TO 13000• Daily Total: $ 33,860

11:30 13:00 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT -15-25' FLARE PEAK GAS 7600units Cum. Wtr: $ 20,745

13:00 13:30 0.5 T.I.H. TO 14100' Cum. Fuel $ 160,393

13:30 14:00 0.5 WASH & REAM FR 14100' - 14245' - NO FILL Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

14:00 16:00 2 CIRC. GAS OUT - 5'-10' FLARE PEAK GAS 3780units BHA

16:00 17:00 1 PUMP 146bbis 14ppg MUD & DISP 73bbis INTO ANNULUS BIT 7-7/8 1.00

17:00 17:30 0.5 T.O.O.H. 12stds BIT SUB 6-1/2 3.03

17:30 18:00 0.5 DISP. ANOTHER 73bbis INTO ANNULUS 18 DC'S 6 1/2 553.18

18:00 18:30 0.5 T.O.O.H. 13stds

18:30 19:00 0.5 P

19:00 4:00 9 L.D.D.P.

4:00 5:00 1 T.I.H. 25stds OUT OF DERRICK

5:00 6:00 1 L.D.D.P.

DIV.0F0]LGAS&MINING
TOTAL BHA = 567.21

Survey 13337 2.5

NOTIFIED JAMIE SPARGER WITH BLM ON UPCOMING CASING & CEMENT JOB 8/5/08 Survey 14242 2.1

PIU K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2000

SIO K# FLARE: 5'- 30' ON BTMS UP Gas Buster: YES CONN GAS NA

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET g 3349' PEAK GAS 9500

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8897 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS 3780-9500

BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O BU A X IN -



CONFilENTIAL
AQ O GASCO ENERGY 7'^/06 A lu

U AUUU L/s OV7-3'& '7G
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/7/08 DAYS: 29

current:operations: CIRC. GAS OUT- RUN CASING
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $4,868 TMC: $119,154 TDC: $36,483 CWC: $2,035,854
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I DrIg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 48 SPM: 101 size: surt.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/18 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 14/22/ SPM: 0 MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 19 AV Dc: 295.8 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvei: 96 FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,868
Dap: 4.2 stm.up: 76 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:30 2.5 L.D.D.P. - LID BHA Misc. I Labor: $ 615
8:30 9:00 .5 PULL WEAR BUSHING Csg. Crew: $ -

9:00 10:30 1.5 SAFETY MEETING - RIG UP CASING CREw Daily Total: $ 36,483

10:30 16:00 5.5 MlUSHOE & FLOAT RUN INTO 5000' Cum. Wtr: $ 20,745

16:00 17:00 1 INSTALL ROT. HEAD & CIRC. GAS OUT Cum. Fuel $ 160,393
17:00 21:00 4 RUN CASING INTO 8000· Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

21:00 22:30 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT BHA

22:30 2:00 3.5 RUN CASING INTO 11000°

2:00 3:30 1.5 ciRc. GAS OUT

3:30 4:30 1 RUN CASING TO 12500'

4:30 6:00 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT

Ht-GEIVt-D

AUCD7 2008
DA0c0tL AcadMNO

TOTALBHA= 0.00

Survey

Survey

PIU K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2000

SIO K# FLARE: 5'- 30' ON BTMS UP Gas Buster: YES CONN GAS NA

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 9500

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8546 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS 3780-9500
BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION 0 0 BU A X IN -

CONFilENTIAL
AQ O GASCO ENERGY 7'^/06 A lu

U AUUU L/s OV7-3'& '7G
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/7/08 DAYS: 29

current:operations: CIRC. GAS OUT- RUN CASING
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $4,868 TMC: $119,154 TDC: $36,483 CWC: $2,035,854
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I DrIg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 48 SPM: 101 size: surt.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/18 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 14/22/ SPM: 0 MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 19 AV Dc: 295.8 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvei: 96 FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,868
Dap: 4.2 stm.up: 76 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:30 2.5 L.D.D.P. - LID BHA Misc. I Labor: $ 615
8:30 9:00 .5 PULL WEAR BUSHING Csg. Crew: $ -

9:00 10:30 1.5 SAFETY MEETING - RIG UP CASING CREw Daily Total: $ 36,483

10:30 16:00 5.5 MlUSHOE & FLOAT RUN INTO 5000' Cum. Wtr: $ 20,745

16:00 17:00 1 INSTALL ROT. HEAD & CIRC. GAS OUT Cum. Fuel $ 160,393
17:00 21:00 4 RUN CASING INTO 8000· Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

21:00 22:30 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT BHA

22:30 2:00 3.5 RUN CASING INTO 11000°

2:00 3:30 1.5 ciRc. GAS OUT

3:30 4:30 1 RUN CASING TO 12500'

4:30 6:00 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT

Ht-GEIVt-D

AUCD7 2008
DA0c0tL AcadMNO

TOTALBHA= 0.00

Survey

Survey

PIU K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2000

SIO K# FLARE: 5'- 30' ON BTMS UP Gas Buster: YES CONN GAS NA

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 9500

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8546 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS 3780-9500

BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
CONDITION 0 0 BU A X IN -

CONFilENTIAL
AQ O GASCO ENERGY 7'^/06 A lu

U AUUU L/s OV7-3'& '7G
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

RKB: 25.6, AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/7/08 DAYS: 29

current:operations: CIRC. GAS OUT- RUN CASING
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $4,868 TMC: $119,154 TDC: $36,483 CWC: $2,035,854
Contracto : N/ BORS 99 Mud Co: M-I DrIg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 12.2 #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

vis: 48 SPM: 101 size: surt.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/18 #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: 14/22/ SPM: 0 MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 5,500
WL: 19 GPM : 352 SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 1850 Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 19 AV Dc: 295.8 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT 12.5 AV DP: 179.8 Depth In: Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : 7.7 Jetvei: 96 FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .00/3.20 ECD: 12.4 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 19000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca : 40 SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,868
Dap: 4.2 stm.up: 76 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Tine Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500
START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:30 2.5 L.D.D.P. - LID BHA Misc. I Labor: $ 615
8:30 9:00 .5 PULL WEAR BUSHING Csg. Crew: $ -

9:00 10:30 1.5 SAFETY MEETING - RIG UP CASING CREw Daily Total: $ 36,483

10:30 16:00 5.5 MlUSHOE & FLOAT RUN INTO 5000' Cum. Wtr: $ 20,745

16:00 17:00 1 INSTALL ROT. HEAD & CIRC. GAS OUT Cum. Fuel $ 160,393
17:00 21:00 4 RUN CASING INTO 8000· Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

21:00 22:30 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT BHA

22:30 2:00 3.5 RUN CASING INTO 11000°

2:00 3:30 1.5 ciRc. GAS OUT

3:30 4:30 1 RUN CASING TO 12500'

4:30 6:00 1.5 CIRC. GAS OUT

Ht-GEIVt-D

AUCD7 2008
DA0c0tL AcadMNO

TOTALBHA= 0.00

Survey

Survey

PIU K# LITH: VENT: YES BKG GAS 2000

SIO K# FLARE: 5'- 30' ON BTMS UP Gas Buster: YES CONN GAS NA

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS 9500

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8546 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS 3780-9500

BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP
CONDITION 0 0 BU A X IN -



GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/8/08 DAYS: 30
current:Operations: RIG DOWN FOR RIG MOVE
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $1,500 TMC: $119,154 TDC: $411,559 CWC: $2,447,413
Contractoi: Nt 30RS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ 286,000 Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: GPM : S/N: Float Equp: $ 5,815 Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ 2,950 water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ 14,680
PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ 69,614
Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca: SPR#2: WOB: PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 1,500
Dap: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti lie Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ 294,765 Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:00 2 RUN CASING Misc. I Labor:

8:00 9:00 1 WASH DOWN CASINGTAGED @14228' Csg. Crew: $ -

9:00 10:00 1 LID jt OF CASING - PULL ROT. HEAD - MAKE UP LANDING JT Daily Total: $ 116,794

CASING LANDED @14193' KB - 1416T GORUND LEVEL Cum. Wtr: $ 20,745
10:00 11:30 1.5 ESTABLISH CIRC.-2" VALVES ON WELL HEAD NEEDED FLUSHED OUT TO BREAK CIRC.- RIG DOWN Cum. Fuel $ 160,393

CASING CREW - STAGED IN SCHLUMBERGER TRUCKS Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

11:30 12:30 1 SAFTEY MEETING WITH SCHLUMBERGER - RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER BHA

12:30 17:00 4.5 CEMENT WITH 20bbis CW100 - LEAD; 895sks G+ADDSYIELD 2.22 12.5ppg; 1st TAIL; 660sks 50I50Por G +

ADDS YIELD 1.53 14.1ppg; 2nd TAIL 445sks 50I50Poz 14,1ppg DISP WITH 201bbis H2O + 2%KCL

BUMPED PLUG @ 16:30 @4000psi 500psi OVER, CHECK FLOATS - HELD - 2.5bbis BACK RECEIVED17:00 18:00 1 RIG DOWN SCHLUBERGER & LID LANDING JT

18:00 22:00 4 NIPPLE DOWN B.O.P. & SET OUT FROM UNDER SUB - CLEAN MUD TANKS

RIG RELEASED @20:00HRS

22:00 6:00 8 RIG DOWN FOR RIG MOVE Ol?09 OlL,G S!i MINING

FINAL REPORT TOTAL BHA = o.oo

Survey

Survey

PIU K# LITH: VENT: BKG GAS

S/O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8546 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS
BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O BU A X IN -

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/8/08 DAYS: 30

current:Operations: RIG DOWN FOR RIG MOVE
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $1,500 TMC: $119,154 TDC: $411,559 CWC: $2,447,413
Contractoi: Nt 30RS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ 286,000 Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: GPM : S/N: Float Equp: $ 5,815 Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ 2,950 water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ 14,680
PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ 69,614
Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca: SPR#2: WOB: PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 1,500
Dap: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti lie Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ 294,765 Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:00 2 RUN CASING Misc. I Labor:

8:00 9:00 1 WASH DOWN CASINGTAGED @14228' Csg. Crew: $ -

9:00 10:00 1 LID jt OF CASING - PULL ROT. HEAD - MAKE UP LANDING JT Daily Total: $ 116,794

CASING LANDED @14193' KB - 1416T GORUND LEVEL Cum. Wtr: $ 20,745

10:00 11:30 1.5 ESTABLISH CIRC.-2" VALVES ON WELL HEAD NEEDED FLUSHED OUT TO BREAK CIRC.- RIG DOWN Cum. Fuel $ 160,393

CASING CREW - STAGED IN SCHLUMBERGER TRUCKS Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

11:30 12:30 1 SAFTEY MEETING WITH SCHLUMBERGER - RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER BHA

12:30 17:00 4.5 CEMENT WITH 20bbis CW100 - LEAD; 895sks G+ADDSYIELD 2.22 12.5ppg; 1st TAIL; 660sks 50I50Por G +

ADDS YIELD 1.53 14.1ppg; 2nd TAIL 445sks 50I50Poz 14,1ppg DISP WITH 201bbis H2O + 2%KCL

BUMPED PLUG @ 16:30 @4000psi 500psi OVER, CHECK FLOATS - HELD - 2.5bbis BACK

RECEIVED17:00 18:00 1 RIG DOWN SCHLUBERGER & LID LANDING JT

18:00 22:00 4 NIPPLE DOWN B.O.P. & SET OUT FROM UNDER SUB - CLEAN MUD TANKS

RIG RELEASED @20:00HRS

22:00 6:00 8 RIG DOWN FOR RIG MOVE Ol?09 OlL,G S!i MINING

FINAL REPORT TOTAL BHA = o.oo

Survey

Survey

PIU K# LITH: VENT: BKG GAS

S/O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8546 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS
BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O BU A X IN -

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy

AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48
RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/8/08 DAYS: 30

current:Operations: RIG DOWN FOR RIG MOVE
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $1,500 TMC: $119,154 TDC: $411,559 CWC: $2,447,413
Contractoi: Nt 30RS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Gardner-Denver PZ10 = 3.488 Bit #: Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: #2 Gardner-Denver PZ 10=3.488 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 24,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ 286,000 Rental Tools: $ 5,500

WL: GPM : S/N: Float Equp: $ 5,815 Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ 2,950 water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ 14,680
PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ 69,614
Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca: SPR#2: WOB: PumpingLIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 1,500
Dap: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti lie Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ 294,765 Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 8:00 2 RUN CASING Misc. I Labor:

8:00 9:00 1 WASH DOWN CASINGTAGED @14228' Csg. Crew: $ -

9:00 10:00 1 LID jt OF CASING - PULL ROT. HEAD - MAKE UP LANDING JT Daily Total: $ 116,794

CASING LANDED @14193' KB - 1416T GORUND LEVEL Cum. Wtr: $ 20,745

10:00 11:30 1.5 ESTABLISH CIRC.-2" VALVES ON WELL HEAD NEEDED FLUSHED OUT TO BREAK CIRC.- RIG DOWN Cum. Fuel $ 160,393

CASING CREW - STAGED IN SCHLUMBERGER TRUCKS Cum. Bits: $ 76,000

11:30 12:30 1 SAFTEY MEETING WITH SCHLUMBERGER - RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER BHA

12:30 17:00 4.5 CEMENT WITH 20bbis CW100 - LEAD; 895sks G+ADDSYIELD 2.22 12.5ppg; 1st TAIL; 660sks 50I50Por G +

ADDS YIELD 1.53 14.1ppg; 2nd TAIL 445sks 50I50Poz 14,1ppg DISP WITH 201bbis H2O + 2%KCL

BUMPED PLUG @ 16:30 @4000psi 500psi OVER, CHECK FLOATS - HELD - 2.5bbis BACK

RECEIVED17:00 18:00 1 RIG DOWN SCHLUBERGER & LID LANDING JT

18:00 22:00 4 NIPPLE DOWN B.O.P. & SET OUT FROM UNDER SUB - CLEAN MUD TANKS

RIG RELEASED @20:00HRS

22:00 6:00 8 RIG DOWN FOR RIG MOVE Ol?09 OlL,G S!i MINING

FINAL REPORT TOTAL BHA = o.oo

Survey

Survey

PIU K# LITH: VENT: BKG GAS

S/O K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8546 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS
BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O BU A X IN -



CONFilENTIAL
G GASCO ENERGY

7-/05 R ler

DAILY DRILLING REPORTEner are 6e o
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/9/08 DAYs: 31

Current: Operations: RIGGING DOWN
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV RoP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS
DMC: $2,093 TMC: $119,154 TDC: $210,498 CWC: $2,657,911
Contractor: NTBORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ 20,650

PVlYP: #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 140,000

Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ -

WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ 14,255

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ 32,000

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,093
Dap: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 20:00 14 RIG DOWN - LID TOP DRIVE, SQUAT SUB & LOWER DERRICK - HAUL MUD TANKS, WATER TANKS, PIPE Misc. I Labor: $ -

TUBS, PIPE SKATE, & MISC. LOADS -ONE CRANE ON LOCATION, SECOND ONE COMING IN MORNING Csg. Crew: $ -

Daily Total: $ 210,498

20:00 6:00 10 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT Cum. Wtr: $ 35,000

Cum. Fuel $ 160,393
cum.sits: $ 110,000

BHA

FINAL REPORT

DIVOF011GAS&MINING TOTAL BHA = o.oo

Survey

Survey

PIU K# LITH: VENT: BKG GAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8935 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS
BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O BU A X IN -

CONFilENTIAL
G GASCO ENERGY

7-/05 R ler

DAILY DRILLING REPORTEner are 6e o
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/9/08 DAYs: 31

Current: Operations: RIGGING DOWN
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV RoP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS

DMC: $2,093 TMC: $119,154 TDC: $210,498 CWC: $2,657,911
Contractor: NTBORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ 20,650

PVlYP: #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 140,000

Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ -

WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ 14,255

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ 32,000

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,093
Dap: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Camps $ -

Ti ne Break Dawn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 1,500

START END TIME 27 Total Rot. Hrs: 370.0 Daily Total: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

6:00 20:00 14 RIG DOWN - LID TOP DRIVE, SQUAT SUB & LOWER DERRICK - HAUL MUD TANKS, WATER TANKS, PIPE Misc. I Labor: $ -

TUBS, PIPE SKATE, & MISC. LOADS -ONE CRANE ON LOCATION, SECOND ONE COMING IN MORNING Csg. Crew: $ -

Daily Total: $ 210,498

20:00 6:00 10 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT Cum. Wtr: $ 35,000

Cum. Fuel $ 160,393
cum.sits: $ 110,000

BHA

FINAL REPORT

DIVOF011GAS&MINING TOTAL BHA = o.oo

Survey

Survey

PIU K# LITH: VENT: BKG GAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8935 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS
BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O BU A X IN -

CONFilENTIAL
G GASCO ENERGY

7-/05 R ler

DAILY DRILLING REPORTEner are 6e o
AFE # 60507 GPS: 39N 58.00 109W 51.48

RKB: 25.6'

Well: UTE FED 42-11-10-18 Per.Depth 14,303 Per.Depth 14,213 DATE 8/9/08 DAYs: 31

Current: Operations: RIGGING DOWN
Depth: 14245' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV RoP: #DIVIO! Formation: MANCOS

DMC: $2,093 TMC: $119,154 TDC: $210,498 CWC: $2,657,911
Contractor: NTBORS 99 Mud Co: M-I Drlg. Flu dS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 Gardner-Denver PZ 10 = 3.488 Bit #: Conductor: $ - RAT HOLE $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ 20,650

PVlYP: #2 Gardner-Denver PZ10=3.488 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 140,000

Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ -

WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ 14,255

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

MBT AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Casing Crew: $ -
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BHA

FINAL REPORT

DIVOF011GAS&MINING TOTAL BHA = o.oo

Survey

Survey

PIU K# LITH: VENT: BKG GAS

SIO K# FLARE: Gas Buster: CONN GAS

ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8-5/8" SET @ 3349' PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 8935 Co.Man J.D.AIIen TRIP GAS
BIT# 7 ICS OCS DC LOC B/S G ODC RP

CONDITION O O BU A X IN -



CONFllENTIAL
Foun 310&5 UNITEDSTATES fi(April2004)

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR Expiæs:March31,2007
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSaialNo

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS DIU¯***"

Do not use this form for proposals to drIll or to re-enteran 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3760-3 (APD) for such proposals. N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Otherinstructions onteverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo

1. Typeof
ilWell GasWell O Oder 8.

WN

NameandNa
Uteland Federal 42-11-10-182. NameofOpemlorGASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. API WellNo.

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo.(àrcludeœea code) 4304738896
8 INVERNESS DR. E, # 100, ENGLEWOOD, CO 80112 303-483-0044 10.Fieldand Pool, orExploratotyArea

4. Locationof Well (Footage,Sec.,T.,R.,M, or SroveyDesc an) Uteland Butte

1591' FNL & 314' FEL SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-R18E 11, CountyorParish, State

Uintah, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NGIIŒ, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off
Noticeof Intent AlterCoing FractureTreat Reclamation WellIntegrity

O SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Olher Complete and

ChangePlans PlugandAbandon TemporarilyAbandon commingle muitpleO FinalAbandonmentNotice ConverttoInjection PlugM WaterDisy pay -

13. Describe Proposedor CompletedOperation(clearly stateall pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximatedurationthereof.
Iftheproposalistodeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasured and truevertical depthsof allpedinentmarkers and zones.
AttachtheBondunder which theworkwill beperformedor providetheBondNo. onfilewith BLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequentreportsshallbefiledwithin 30days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. Ifthe operdtion results ina multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form31604 shall befiledonce
testinghasbeencompleted.FinalAbandonmentNoticesshall befiledonlyafter allrequirements, includingreclamation,havebeencompleted, and theoperator has
determinedthatthesiteis ready forfinalinspection.)

Gasco intends to complete productive intervals in the Mancos and Mesaverde formations and to commingle pr
Following the final fracture stimulation, a Completion Report willbe submitted.

No new surface disturbance is anticipated. Ifany is necessary, prior approval will be obtained.

If required, the method used to account for and to allocate production from each pool so commingled will be by individual interval hydrocarbon pore
volume calculation.

Gasco Production Company is the owner of all contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the pools, Gasco herewith waive it's right to
the 15-day period of objection per UDOGM Rule 649-3-22(3), and respectfully requests that the Division thereforeaccept this NOI in lieu of the
required affidavitwith regard to notification of the aforementionedowners.

Attachment: Exhibit showing the location of all wells on contiguous oil and gas lease or drilling units overlying the subject pools.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Matthew Owens Title Petroleum Engineer i

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE E

Conditionsof approval,if any, are attached. Approvalof thisnotice doesnot warrant or . and M et\on\sNecessani
certifythat theapplicant holdslegalor equitable title tothoserights inthe subjectlease 0 ewhich would entitle the applicantto conductoperationsthereon.
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Tide43 U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crirne for e ent or agency ofthe UnitedStatesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsorrepresentationsasto anymatterwithin sju is ti ß¯
(Instructionson page 2) UË

SEPO2 2008

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&
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CONFllENTIAL
Gasco Production Company

Uteland Fed 42-11-10-18
SE NE of Section 11-T10S-R18E

Uintah County, Utah
API: 43-047-38896

9/10/08 RU JW wireline run csg bond log. TOC inside surface esg. Good cement
across pay zones. RU B&C quick test. Psi test csg to l1,500 psi, test good.

9/23/08 RU JW wire line. RIH w/guns perfs stage-1 Lower Mancos I f/14,118-
22' RU superior ws. Break dn perfs w/9,350 @ 1.5 bpm. Finish perf
f/13,928-32', 13,953-57', 14,010-14', 14,106-10'. POOH. RU to frac.
Pump into perfs w/8,833 @4.1 bpm. SD. ISIP 8,145 FG 1.02 Pump 1,000
gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick water/Linear gel frac well w/50,000# 40/70
Prime plus sand, 3,558 bbls FR slick water/linear gel, and flushed w/208
bbls FR slick water. SD. ISIP 7,819 FG .99 Average rate 34 bpm, Average
psi 9,900 RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Bio ball FTFP @13,630', Perf
stage-2 Lower Mancos II f/13,608-12 try to break dn perfs, would not
break, Perf £/13,599-603', perfs would still not break dn. Next gun would
not fire, POOH. Break dn perfs while wireline OOH. Break @10,530 w/ 1
bpm. RIH w/plug and guns perf f/13,571-75, next gun would not fire.
POOH. Repair and RIH w/guns. Finish perf ¾/13,533-37', 13,559-63'.
POOH. SWI, SDFN. (JD)

9/24/08 RU to frac. Pump into perfs @8,505 w/3.3 bpm. SD. ISIP 7,374 FG .98

Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL Acid. Had to SD during the first 1# stage, rates
and psi not working correctly. FR Slick water/linear gel frac well
w/62,700# 40/70 Prime plus sand, 4,719 bbls FR slick water/linear gel,
and flushed w/202 bbls FR slick water. SD. ISIP 7,589 FG 1.0. Average
rate 34 bpm, Average psi 8,800 RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum
Bio ball FTFP @13,510', Perf stage-3 Mancos III f/13,493-97'. Break

RECEIVED dn perfs w/8,650 @2 bpm. Finish perf f/13,336-40', 13,421-24', 13,430-

34', 13,476-80'. POOH. RU to frac. Pump into perf w/8,045 @ 5 bpm.
OCT102008 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick water/linear gel frac well

w/55,000# 40/70 Prime plus sand, 4,001 bbls FR slick water/linear gel,
DN.OFOIL,GAS&MINING and flushed w/199 bbls FR slick water. SD. ISIP 7,455 FG 1.0 Average

rate 31.5, Average psi 9,253. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum Bio
ball FTFP @ 13,250', Perf stage-4 Mancos IIII ¾/13,224-28',Break dn
perfs w/8,400 @2bpm. Finish perf f/13,145-49', 13,158-62', 13,171-75',
13,185-89', 13,214-18', POOH. SWI. SDFD. (JD).

9/25/08 RU to frac. Pump into perfs w/7,891 @3.3 bpm. SD ISIP 7,477 FG 1.0
Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL Acid. FR slick water/linear gel frac well
w/57,900# 40/70 Prime plus sand, job called for 74,700#, cut short due to
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psi, 4,497 bbls FR slick water/linear gel, and flushed w/198 bbls FR slick
water. SD. ISIP 7,477 FG 1.0 Average rate 36 bpm, Average psi 9,950
RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum Bio ball FTFP @13,110'perf
stage-5 Erickson f/13,088-92' Break dn perf w/7,780 @2 bpm. Finish
perf f/12,992-96', 13,006-10', 13,064-68'. POOH. RU to frac. Pump into
perfs w/7,816 @ 3 bpm. SD. ISIP 7,453 FG 1.0 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5%
HCL Acid. FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/34,000# 40/70 Prime plus
sand, 2,481 bb1s FR slick water/linear gel. Had to shutdown during the
1.5# sand stage, washed out a lotore valve on wellhead. Shut master valve
and wing valve. When we tried to open the master valve to start pumping
again it would not open all the way. Called Well head inc to came and
service valve. SDFD. (JD)

9/26/08 No work on well today. Hauled water and transferred water. Will continue
frac in the a.m.

9/27/08 SWI @4:36 a.m. w/6,050 on a 12/64 ek, Made 1,682 bbls in 17 hrs 34
min, TR 1,682 bbls, BLWTR 18,558 bbls. RIH w/plug. Set 10k Magnum
bio ball FTFP @13,076'. Covered up bottom perf f/13,088-92'. POOH.
RU to frac. Psi test wellhead and wing valve not holding psi. SD wait on
Well Head Inc for new wing valve's.

9/28/08 RU to frac. Pump into perfs w/8,700 @3 bpm. FR slick water frac well
w/36,600# 40/70 Prime plus sand, 2,265 bbls FR slick water, and flushed
w/195 bbls FR slick water. SD. ISIP 8,089 FG 1.06 Average rate 30 bpm,
Average psi 9,250 psi. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum Bio Ball
FTFP 12,496' Perf stage-6 MN 21 f/12,408-12', 12,476-50', POOH. RU
to frac. Pump into perfs w/8,830 @3 bpm. SD. ISIP 6,856 FG 1.0 FR 714
bbls into pad could not get gel pump to come on. SD. After 5 min psi went
f/6,500 to 6,300 to 6,850, was not pumping. Try to get back into perfs and
well pressured out to 11,600 psi. SD. Psi held tight. SDFD. Will RIH
w/sinker bars on Monday to see if plug moved. (JD)

9/29/08 RIH w/sinker bars. Tag plug @ 12,450'. POOH. Open well up to fb
w/6,500 on a 10/64 ck.

9/30/08 7:00 5,700 on a 10/64 ck. Made 1,066 bb1sin 20 hr's 40 min's, TR 2,748
bbls, BLWTR 20,868 bb1s.

10/1/08 7:00 a.m. 5,000 on a 10/64 ck. Made 919 bbls 24 hrs. TR 3,667 bbls
BLWTR 19,949 bbls

10/2/08 7:00 a.m. 4,200 on a 10/64 ck made 671 bbls in 21 hrs 33 min. TR 4,338
bbls, BLWTR 19,278 bbls.
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BLWTR 19,949 bbls

10/2/08 7:00 a.m. 4,200 on a 10/64 ck made 671 bbls in 21 hrs 33 min. TR 4,338
bbls, BLWTR 19,278 bbls.

Page 2 of 4
Uteland Federal

psi, 4,497 bbls FR slick water/linear gel, and flushed w/198 bbls FR slick
water. SD. ISIP 7,477 FG 1.0 Average rate 36 bpm, Average psi 9,950
RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum Bio ball FTFP @13,110'perf
stage-5 Erickson f/13,088-92' Break dn perf w/7,780 @2 bpm. Finish
perf f/12,992-96', 13,006-10', 13,064-68'. POOH. RU to frac. Pump into
perfs w/7,816 @ 3 bpm. SD. ISIP 7,453 FG 1.0 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5%
HCL Acid. FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/34,000# 40/70 Prime plus
sand, 2,481 bb1s FR slick water/linear gel. Had to shutdown during the
1.5# sand stage, washed out a lotore valve on wellhead. Shut master valve
and wing valve. When we tried to open the master valve to start pumping
again it would not open all the way. Called Well head inc to came and
service valve. SDFD. (JD)

9/26/08 No work on well today. Hauled water and transferred water. Will continue
frac in the a.m.

9/27/08 SWI @4:36 a.m. w/6,050 on a 12/64 ek, Made 1,682 bbls in 17 hrs 34
min, TR 1,682 bbls, BLWTR 18,558 bbls. RIH w/plug. Set 10k Magnum
bio ball FTFP @13,076'. Covered up bottom perf f/13,088-92'. POOH.
RU to frac. Psi test wellhead and wing valve not holding psi. SD wait on
Well Head Inc for new wing valve's.

9/28/08 RU to frac. Pump into perfs w/8,700 @3 bpm. FR slick water frac well
w/36,600# 40/70 Prime plus sand, 2,265 bbls FR slick water, and flushed
w/195 bbls FR slick water. SD. ISIP 8,089 FG 1.06 Average rate 30 bpm,
Average psi 9,250 psi. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum Bio Ball
FTFP 12,496' Perf stage-6 MN 21 f/12,408-12', 12,476-50', POOH. RU
to frac. Pump into perfs w/8,830 @3 bpm. SD. ISIP 6,856 FG 1.0 FR 714
bbls into pad could not get gel pump to come on. SD. After 5 min psi went
f/6,500 to 6,300 to 6,850, was not pumping. Try to get back into perfs and
well pressured out to 11,600 psi. SD. Psi held tight. SDFD. Will RIH
w/sinker bars on Monday to see if plug moved. (JD)

9/29/08 RIH w/sinker bars. Tag plug @ 12,450'. POOH. Open well up to fb
w/6,500 on a 10/64 ck.

9/30/08 7:00 5,700 on a 10/64 ck. Made 1,066 bb1sin 20 hr's 40 min's, TR 2,748
bbls, BLWTR 20,868 bb1s.

10/1/08 7:00 a.m. 5,000 on a 10/64 ck. Made 919 bbls 24 hrs. TR 3,667 bbls
BLWTR 19,949 bbls

10/2/08 7:00 a.m. 4,200 on a 10/64 ck made 671 bbls in 21 hrs 33 min. TR 4,338
bbls, BLWTR 19,278 bbls.
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10/3/08 7:00 a.m. 3,300 on a 10/64 ck. Made 592 bbls in 23 hrs 43 min, TR 4,930
bbls, BLWTR 18,686 bbls.

10/4/08 7:00 a.m. 2,700 on a 10/64 ck. Made 446 in 24 hrs. TR 5,376 bbls,
BLWTR 18,240 bbls.

10/6/08 7:00 a.m. 3,000 on a 8/64 ck. Made 304 bbls in 24 hrs TR 5,680 bb1s,
BLWTR 17,936 bbls. RU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/3 5/8" Clear cut mill+2
7/8" ECTD even wall motor+2 7/8" jars+disconnect+jars. Tag plug #1 @
12,450' drill up and saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #2 @13,076drill up and
saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #3 @ 13,110' drill up and saw 2,000 psi inc.
RIH tag plug #4 @13,250'drill up and saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #5
@13,210'drill up and saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #6 @ 13,630' drill up
and saw 0 psi inc RIH tag @14,158'Cric and POOH. Will continue to
frac in the a.m. Open up to fb @6:04 w/5,100 on a 10/64 ck. SDFD. (JD)

10/7/08 SWI @4:00 a.m. w/4,800 on a 10/64 ck. Made 347 bbls in 9 hrs 56 min.
TR 6,027 bbls, BLWTR 17,589 bbls. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k
Magnum Bio ball FTFP @12,520' Reperf stage-6 MN-21 f/12,410-11',
12,478-79'. POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/7,939 @3.5 bpm. Pump
1,000 gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/69,600#
40/70 Prime plus sand, 2,332 bbls FR slick water/linear gel, and flushed
w/186 bb1s FR slick water. SD. ISIP 5,877 FG .92 Average rate 37,
Average psi 8,500. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum Bio Ball
FTFP @ 11,954' Perf stage-7 Spring Canyon f/11,930-38'. POOH. RU
to frac. Break dn perfs w/5,219 @ 3.5 bpm. SD. ISIP 5,019 FG .85

calculate holes open 13. Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh sand,
132,300# 20/40 Versaprop, 2,441 bbls XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/166
bbls 10# linear gel. SD. ISIP 5,032 FG .87. Open well up to fb @7:13
p.m. w/4,300 on a 10/64 ck. Coil tbg will be on loc in the a.m. to drill
plugs. SDFD. (JD)

10/8/08 7:00 5,000 10/64 Made 546 bbls in 11 hrs 47 mins, TR 6573 bbls,
BLWTR 22,169 bbls MIRU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/3 5/8" Clear cut mill+2
7/8" ECTD even wall motor+2 7/8" jars+disconnect.Tag plug #1 @
11,954' drill up and saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #2 @12,520' drill up and
saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag PBTD @14,143'. Circ and POOH. RDMO CTS
coil tbg. Open well up to fb @ 4:40 p.m. w/4,850 psi on a 10/64 ck.
SDFD. (JD)

10/9/08 7:00 a.m. 4,850 on a 10/64 ck. Made 516 bbls in 16 hr 10 min. TR 7,089
bbls, BLWTR 21,653 bbls. (JD)
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calculate holes open 13. Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh sand,
132,300# 20/40 Versaprop, 2,441 bbls XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/166
bbls 10# linear gel. SD. ISIP 5,032 FG .87. Open well up to fb @7:13
p.m. w/4,300 on a 10/64 ck. Coil tbg will be on loc in the a.m. to drill
plugs. SDFD. (JD)

10/8/08 7:00 5,000 10/64 Made 546 bbls in 11 hrs 47 mins, TR 6573 bbls,
BLWTR 22,169 bbls MIRU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/3 5/8" Clear cut mill+2
7/8" ECTD even wall motor+2 7/8" jars+disconnect.Tag plug #1 @
11,954' drill up and saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #2 @12,520' drill up and
saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag PBTD @14,143'. Circ and POOH. RDMO CTS
coil tbg. Open well up to fb @ 4:40 p.m. w/4,850 psi on a 10/64 ck.
SDFD. (JD)
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7/8" ECTD even wall motor+2 7/8" jars+disconnect+jars. Tag plug #1 @
12,450' drill up and saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #2 @13,076drill up and
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and saw 0 psi inc RIH tag @14,158'Cric and POOH. Will continue to
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TR 6,027 bbls, BLWTR 17,589 bbls. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k
Magnum Bio ball FTFP @12,520' Reperf stage-6 MN-21 f/12,410-11',
12,478-79'. POOH. RU to frac. Break dn perfs w/7,939 @3.5 bpm. Pump
1,000 gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/69,600#
40/70 Prime plus sand, 2,332 bbls FR slick water/linear gel, and flushed
w/186 bb1s FR slick water. SD. ISIP 5,877 FG .92 Average rate 37,
Average psi 8,500. RIH w/plug and guns. Set 10k Magnum Bio Ball
FTFP @ 11,954' Perf stage-7 Spring Canyon f/11,930-38'. POOH. RU
to frac. Break dn perfs w/5,219 @ 3.5 bpm. SD. ISIP 5,019 FG .85

calculate holes open 13. Hybrid frac well w/5,000# 100 mesh sand,
132,300# 20/40 Versaprop, 2,441 bbls XL-BHT gel, and flushed w/166
bbls 10# linear gel. SD. ISIP 5,032 FG .87. Open well up to fb @7:13
p.m. w/4,300 on a 10/64 ck. Coil tbg will be on loc in the a.m. to drill
plugs. SDFD. (JD)

10/8/08 7:00 5,000 10/64 Made 546 bbls in 11 hrs 47 mins, TR 6573 bbls,
BLWTR 22,169 bbls MIRU CTS coil tbg. RIH w/3 5/8" Clear cut mill+2
7/8" ECTD even wall motor+2 7/8" jars+disconnect.Tag plug #1 @
11,954' drill up and saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag plug #2 @12,520' drill up and
saw 0 psi inc. RIH tag PBTD @14,143'. Circ and POOH. RDMO CTS
coil tbg. Open well up to fb @ 4:40 p.m. w/4,850 psi on a 10/64 ck.
SDFD. (JD)

10/9/08 7:00 a.m. 4,850 on a 10/64 ck. Made 516 bbls in 16 hr 10 min. TR 7,089
bbls, BLWTR 21,653 bbls. (JD)
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10/10/08 7:00 a.m. 4,500 on a 12/64 ck. Made 960 bb1sin 21 hrs 30 mins, TR 8,049
bbls, BLWTR 20,693. Turn well over to first sales 10/9/08 @ 6:00
w/4,500 on a 10/64 ck. Final frac #'s TR 8,541 bbls, BLWTR 20,201 bbls.
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10/10/08 7:00 a.m. 4,500 on a 12/64 ck. Made 960 bb1sin 21 hrs 30 mins, TR 8,049
bbls, BLWTR 20,693. Turn well over to first sales 10/9/08 @ 6:00
w/4,500 on a 10/64 ck. Final frac #'s TR 8,541 bbls, BLWTR 20,201 bbls.
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bbls, BLWTR 20,693. Turn well over to first sales 10/9/08 @ 6:00
w/4,500 on a 10/64 ck. Final frac #'s TR 8,541 bbls, BLWTR 20,201 bbls.
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Fonn 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires:March 31, 2007

5. Lease SerialNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD)for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instnictions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. AgreementName and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federa1 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API WellNo.
3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo.(includeareacode) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 | 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location ofWell (Footage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) Uteland Butte
1591' FNL & 314' FEL 11. County or Parish, State

SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-R18E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(clearlystate all pertinentdetails,includingestimated startingdate of any proposedwork and approximateduration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent rnarkers and zones.
Attach the Bond undcr which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsoluent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completionor recompletion in a new interval,a Form316(M shall be filed once
testinghas been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined thatthe site is ready for final inspection.

This well was started on production on 10/9/2008.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Jessica Berg Production Clerk

Signature , Date'' October 10, 2008
S SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

0CT2O2008
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which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
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Fonn 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires:March 31, 2007

5. Lease SerialNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD)for such proposals. NA
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1. Type of Well NA
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4. Location ofWell (Footage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) Uteland Butte
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Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(clearlystate all pertinentdetails,includingestimated startingdate of any proposedwork and approximateduration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent rnarkers and zones.
Attach the Bond undcr which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsoluent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completionor recompletion in a new interval,a Form316(M shall be filed once
testinghas been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined thatthe site is ready for final inspection.
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Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)
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' varmaiso-s UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instnictions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil Weß Gas Wen Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R., M , or Survey Description) Uteland Butte

159l' FNL & 314' FEL 11. countyor Parish, State

SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-R18E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OFACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production(Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon TemporarilyAbandon

Final AbandomnentNotice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations(clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor tecomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinot markets and zones.
Attach the Bond undcr which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequent reports shallbe filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 316Œ4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final AbandonmentNoticesshall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthat thesite isready forfinalinspection.

This is to inform you that we will be disposing ofwater fromthis well as follows:

All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
the Desert Spring State Evaporation Facility NW1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E
Uintah County Utah. Which is owned by Gasco Production Company.

Accepted by the
Utd Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Jessica Berg Production Clerk

Signature Date
October 10, 2008

IS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICEUSE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereen. RFCEIVED
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfinly to make any department or agency of the United

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

' varmaiso-s UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instnictions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil Weß Gas Wen Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R., M , or Survey Description) Uteland Butte

159l' FNL & 314' FEL 11. countyor Parish, State

SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-R18E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OFACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production(Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon TemporarilyAbandon

Final AbandomnentNotice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations(clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor tecomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinot markets and zones.
Attach the Bond undcr which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequent reports shallbe filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 316Œ4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final AbandonmentNoticesshall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthat thesite isready forfinalinspection.

This is to inform you that we will be disposing ofwater fromthis well as follows:

All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
the Desert Spring State Evaporation Facility NW1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E
Uintah County Utah. Which is owned by Gasco Production Company.

Accepted by the
Utd Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Jessica Berg Production Clerk

Signature Date
October 10, 2008

IS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICEUSE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereen. RFCEIVED
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfinly to make any department or agency of the United

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

' varmaiso-s UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instnictions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well NA
Oil Weß Gas Wen Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R., M , or Survey Description) Uteland Butte

159l' FNL & 314' FEL 11. countyor Parish, State

SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-R18E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OFACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production(Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon TemporarilyAbandon

Final AbandomnentNotice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations(clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor tecomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinot markets and zones.
Attach the Bond undcr which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequent reports shallbe filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 316Œ4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final AbandonmentNoticesshall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthat thesite isready forfinalinspection.

This is to inform you that we will be disposing ofwater fromthis well as follows:

All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
the Desert Spring State Evaporation Facility NW1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E
Uintah County Utah. Which is owned by Gasco Production Company.

Accepted by the
Utd Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Jessica Berg Production Clerk

Signature Date
October 10, 2008

IS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICEUSE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereen. RFCEIVED
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfinly to make any department or agency of the United

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



rormaiso- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- Ol37

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or cA. Agreement Name and/or No.

I. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator UtelandFederal42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. APIWe11No.
3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 | 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R, M., or Survey Description) Uteland Butte

1591'FNL & 314' FEL 11. countyor Parish, State

SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-Rl8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORI', OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon EFM Meter

Final Abandomnent Notice Convert to lajection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinentdetails,includingestirnated starting date of any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 316¾ shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have bem completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 35oo) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR ACC
by th

Date: FederalApprova\OfThis

Initials:
ActionisNecessary

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true òrrect.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Jessica Berg Production Clerk

Signature Date
October 10, 2008

TH PACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant oi
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its tunsdiction.

(Instructions on page

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&

rormaiso- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- Ol37

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or cA. Agreement Name and/or No.

I. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator UtelandFederal42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. APIWe11No.
3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 | 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R, M., or Survey Description) Uteland Butte

1591'FNL & 314' FEL 11. countyor Parish, State

SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-Rl8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORI', OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon EFM Meter

Final Abandomnent Notice Convert to lajection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinentdetails,includingestirnated starting date of any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 316¾ shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have bem completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 35oo) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR ACC
by th

Date: FederalApprova\OfThis

Initials:
ActionisNecessary

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true òrrect.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Jessica Berg Production Clerk

Signature Date
October 10, 2008

TH PACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant oi
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its tunsdiction.

(Instructions on page

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&

rormaiso- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- Ol37

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or cA. Agreement Name and/or No.

I. Type of Well NA
Oil well Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator UtelandFederal42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. APIWe11No.
3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 | 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R, M., or Survey Description) Uteland Butte

1591'FNL & 314' FEL 11. countyor Parish, State

SE NE of Sec 11-T10S-Rl8E Uintah, UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORI', OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon EFM Meter

Final Abandomnent Notice Convert to lajection Plug back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinentdetails,includingestirnated starting date of any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 316¾ shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have bem completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 35oo) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR ACC
by th

Date: FederalApprova\OfThis

Initials:
ActionisNecessary

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true òrrect.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Jessica Berg Production Clerk

Signature Date
October 10, 2008

TH PACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant oi
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its tunsdiction.

(Instructions on page

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



F 3160 4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(A tid 9) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR */ OMBNO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG */ 5. LeaseSerialNo.
UTU-Ol3429

la. Type of Well O Oil Well Å Gas O Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: New Q Work Over O Deepen O Plug Back O Diff. Resvr. NA

Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Nameand No.
NA2. Name of Operator 8. Lease Name and Well No.

Gasco Production CompanV Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
3. Address 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. APi Well No.
8 inverness Drive East Suite 100, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 43-047-38896
4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surface 1591' FNL & 314' FEL Uteland Butte

11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and
At top prod. interval reported below Sarne Survey or Area See 11 T108 RISE

12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth Sar Tie Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16.þgte Complete 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

4/21..] D & A Ready to Prod.03/30/08 08/30/08 GL: 4932.3' KB: 4957.7'10/10/08
18. Total Depth: MD 14245 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 14143 20. Depth I ridge Plug Set: MD NA

TVD 14245 TVD 14143 TVD NA
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Loas Run (Submit conv of enchi 22. Was well V No O Yes (Submit copy)

Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)
Directional Ô No Yes (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)
Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry VolHole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount Pulled

Depth Type of Cement (BBL)
24" 16" H-40 65# 0 60 250 sx Class G Cire to Surf

12 1/4" 8 5/8 J 55 32# 0 3349 1150 sx CInss G Circ to Surf

7 7/8" 4 1/2 PIl0 13.5# 0 14193 895 sx Class G Inside Surf
1105 sx 50/50 Poz (

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status

A; Mancos 12408 14122 See Attached

gy Mesaverde I1918 11926

D)
El
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
See Attached

28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
10/10/08 10/16/08 24 9 0 752 556 Flowing

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

10/64 SI 3848 9 0 752 556 Flowing from A & B
28a.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Prod BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravhy RECEIVED
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size F1wg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

SI

(See instructions and spaces foradditional data on reverse side) Dbl 06 O L,GÄS&id MÑ

F 3160 4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(A tid 9) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR */ OMBNO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG */ 5. LeaseSerialNo.
UTU-Ol3429

la. Type of Well O Oil Well Å Gas O Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: New Q Work Over O Deepen O Plug Back O Diff. Resvr. NA

Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Nameand No.
NA2. Name of Operator

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Gasco Production CompanV Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
3. Address 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. APi Well No.
8 inverness Drive East Suite 100, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 43-047-38896
4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surface 1591' FNL & 314' FEL Uteland Butte

11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and
At top prod. interval reported below Sarne Survey or Area See 11 T108 RISE

12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth Sar Tie Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16.þgte Complete 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

4/21..] D & A Ready to Prod.03/30/08 08/30/08 GL: 4932.3' KB: 4957.7'
10/10/08

18. Total Depth: MD 14245 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 14143 20. Depth I ridge Plug Set: MD NA
TVD 14245 TVD 14143 TVD NA

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Loas Run (Submit conv of enchi 22. Was well V No O Yes (Submit copy)
Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)
Directional Ô No Yes (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)
Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry VolHole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount Pulled

Depth Type of Cement (BBL)
24" 16" H-40 65# 0 60 250 sx Class G Cire to Surf

12 1/4" 8 5/8 J 55 32# 0 3349 1150 sx CInss G Circ to Surf

7 7/8" 4 1/2 PIl0 13.5# 0 14193 895 sx Class G Inside Surf
1105 sx 50/50 Poz (

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status

A; Mancos 12408 14122 See Attached

gy Mesaverde I1918 11926

D)
El
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
See Attached

28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
10/10/08 10/16/08 24 9 0 752 556 Flowing

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

10/64 SI 3848 9 0 752 556 Flowing from A & B
28a.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Prod BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravhy RECEIVED
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size F1wg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

SI

(See instructions and spaces foradditional data on reverse side) Dbl 06 O L,GÄS&id MÑ

F 3160 4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(A tid 9) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR */ OMBNO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG */ 5. LeaseSerialNo.
UTU-Ol3429

la. Type of Well O Oil Well Å Gas O Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: New Q Work Over O Deepen O Plug Back O Diff. Resvr. NA

Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Nameand No.
NA2. Name of Operator

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Gasco Production CompanV Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
3. Address 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. APi Well No.
8 inverness Drive East Suite 100, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 43-047-38896
4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surface 1591' FNL & 314' FEL Uteland Butte

11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and
At top prod. interval reported below Sarne Survey or Area See 11 T108 RISE

12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth Sar Tie Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16.þgte Complete 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

4/21..] D & A Ready to Prod.03/30/08 08/30/08 GL: 4932.3' KB: 4957.7'
10/10/08

18. Total Depth: MD 14245 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 14143 20. Depth I ridge Plug Set: MD NA
TVD 14245 TVD 14143 TVD NA

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Loas Run (Submit conv of enchi 22. Was well V No O Yes (Submit copy)
Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)
Directional Ô No Yes (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)
Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry VolHole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount Pulled

Depth Type of Cement (BBL)
24" 16" H-40 65# 0 60 250 sx Class G Cire to Surf

12 1/4" 8 5/8 J 55 32# 0 3349 1150 sx CInss G Circ to Surf

7 7/8" 4 1/2 PIl0 13.5# 0 14193 895 sx Class G Inside Surf
1105 sx 50/50 Poz (

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status

A; Mancos 12408 14122 See Attached

gy Mesaverde I1918 11926

D)
El
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
See Attached

28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
10/10/08 10/16/08 24 9 0 752 556 Flowing

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

10/64 SI 3848 9 0 752 556 Flowing from A & B
28a.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Prod BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravhy RECEIVED
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size F1wg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

SI

(See instructions and spaces foradditional data on reverse side) Dbl 06 O L,GÄS&id MÑ



$8b.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas: Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

28c. Production - Interval E
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity roduction Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Sold, usedfor fuel,vented, etc.)

Sold
30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas. Depth

Wasatch 4,772 8,660
Mesaverde 8,660 12,450
Mancos 12,450 14,245 Well TD'd within the Mancos

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procer ure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (l full set reg'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) MS Title Petroleum Engineer

Signature Date

Title 18U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

o U.S. GPO:
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Title 18U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

o U.S. GPO:



Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Additional Information to WellCompletion Report

27. Perforation Record
Perforated Interval Size io. Hole Perf. Status

13928-32; 13953-57; 14010-14; 14106-10; 14118-22 0.38 60 Open

13533-37; 13559-63; 13571-75; 13608-12 0.38 48 Open
13336-40; 13421-24; 13430-34; 13476-80; 13493-97 0.38 60 Open

13145-49; 13158-62; 13171-75; 13185-89; 13214-18; 13224-28 0.38 72 Open
12992-96; 13006-10; 13064-68; 13088-92 0.38 48 Open

12408-12; 12476-80 0.38 24 Open
11918-26 0.38 24 Open

28. Acid Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued)
Deptil Interval Amount and Type of Material
13928-14122 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick water/Linear gel frac well w/50,000# 40/70 Prime plussand, 3,558 bbls FR slick water/finear gel

13533-13612 FR Slick water/linear gel frac well w/62,700# 40/70 Prime plussand, 4,719 bb1sFR slick water/linear gel

13336-13497 Pump 1,000gal 7.5% HCL acid. FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/55,000# 40/70 Prime plussand, 4,001 bbls FR slick water/linear gel
13145-13228 Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL Acid. FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/57,900# 40/70 Prime plussand, job called for 74,700#,

12992-13092 Pump 1000 gal 7.5% HCL. FR slickwater/linear gel frac well w/ 70,600# 40/70 primeplusand 4,746 bbls FR slickwater/linear gel

12408-12480 Pump 1,000 ga17.5% HCL acid. FR slick water/linear gel frac well w/69,600# 40/70 Prime plus
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Forrn3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MA MENT Expires:March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND RE OT L UTU-013429

Do not use this form for proposals o TI t noian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned weH. Use Form 3160-3 ( D s p NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse siŠÐ.$ Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well
Oil Well Gas Well other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Uteland Federal 42-11-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo.(includeareacode) 4304738896
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. FieldandPool,orExploratoryArea

4. LocationofWell(Footage,Sec., 7, R.,M.,orSurveyDescription) Uteland Butte
1591' FNL & 314' FEL 11. CountyorParish,State

SENEofSecll-TIOS-Ri8E Uintah,UT
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Statt/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Run Tubing

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposedor CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximate dumtionthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.
Attach the Bond unde which the work will be performed or providethe Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filedwithin 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedopemtions. If the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. FinalAbandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthat the site isready forfinalinspection.

Gasco landed 399 joint of2 3/8" 4.7# P-110 tubing with a 1.875" X-nipple on bottom @12,450'
on 3/13/2009.

14. I hereby certify that the fore ing is true and correct.
Name (Printed' Typed)

Matt Owens Petroleum Engineer

Signature Date
May 10, 2009

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached.Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfullsk epartment or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. BECF

(Instructions on page 2)

gg i 8 2009

DIV.0FOlt,GAS&
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Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfullsk epartment or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. BECF
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API Well No: 43047388960000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-013429 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UTELAND BUTTE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1591 FNL 0314 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

7/1/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco intends to fracture treat all remaining productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation. Gasco has identified approximately 5 different zones

that will be fracture treated within this formation. Each zone will be
stimulated with roughly 1,500 barrels of water and 60,000 lbs of white sand.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Matt Owens

TITLE
 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6/16/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 483-0044  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 996-1839

June 16, 2010

June 22, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047388960000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAs0E13DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext UTELAND BUTTE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

1591 FNL 0314 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

7/1/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to fracture treat all remaining productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation. Gasco has identified approximately 5 different zones Accepted by the

that will be fracture treated within this formation. Each zone will be Utah Division of
stimulated with roughly 1,500 barrels of water and 60,000 lbs of white sand. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Jun 2Z, 201

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/16/2010

RECEIVED June 16,

iPI Well No: 43047388960000
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Qtr/Qtr; SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

7/1/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to fracture treat all remaining productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation. Gasco has identified approximately 5 different zones Accepted by the

that will be fracture treated within this formation. Each zone will be Utah Division of
stimulated with roughly 1,500 barrels of water and 60,000 lbs of white sand. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Jun 2Z, 201

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/16/2010

RECEIVED June 16,

iPI Well No: 43047388960000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAs0E13DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext UTELAND BUTTE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

1591 FNL 0314 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

7/1/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to fracture treat all remaining productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation. Gasco has identified approximately 5 different zones Accepted by the

that will be fracture treated within this formation. Each zone will be Utah Division of
stimulated with roughly 1,500 barrels of water and 60,000 lbs of white sand. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Jun 2Z, 201

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/16/2010

RECEIVED June 16,



API Well No: 43047388960000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-013429 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UTELAND BUTTE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1591 FNL 0314 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

10/15/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco would like to dispose of water at LaPoint Recycle & Storage state
approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 12 Township 5 south
Range 19 west in LaPoint UT. This facility would be used in addition to the

currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water from
this well.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Roger Knight 303 996-1803

TITLE
 EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/8/2010

October 08, 2010

October 11, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047388960000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAs0E DE2sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext UTELAND BUTTE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1591 FNL 0314 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at LaPoint Recycle & Storage state
approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 12 Township 5 soutAccepted by the

Range 19 west in LaPoint UT. This facility would be used in addition to the Utah Division of
currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water fDIT Gas and Mining

this well. FOR REÇggggY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/8/2010

RECEIVED October 08,

iPI Well No: 43047388960000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAs0E DE2sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext UTELAND BUTTE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1591 FNL 0314 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at LaPoint Recycle & Storage state
approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 12 Township 5 soutAccepted by the

Range 19 west in LaPoint UT. This facility would be used in addition to the Utah Division of
currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water fDIT Gas and Mining

this well. FOR REÇggggY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/8/2010

RECEIVED October 08,

iPI Well No: 43047388960000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAs0E DE2sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext UTELAND BUTTE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1591 FNL 0314 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at LaPoint Recycle & Storage state
approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 12 Township 5 soutAccepted by the

Range 19 west in LaPoint UT. This facility would be used in addition to the Utah Division of
currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water fDIT Gas and Mining

this well. FOR REÇggggY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/8/2010

RECEIVED October 08,



API Well No: 43047388960000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-013429 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UTELAND BUTTE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1591 FNL 0314 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

8/22/2010

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco finished fracture treating seven remaining productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation. Plugs were drilled and recompletion activities

culminated with the landing of tubing at 8'657' on 8/22/2010. The volumes of
sand and water pumped in each stage can be found on the attached wellbore
schematic under stage 8 through stage 14. The well is currently producing out

of the Mancos and Mesaverde formations.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/21/2010

October 21, 2010

October 25, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047388960000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAs0E DE2sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext UTELAND BUTTE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1591 FNL 0314 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/22/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

sPuD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco finished fracture treating seven remaining productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation. Plugs were drilled and recompletion activities Accepted by the

culminated with the landing of tubing at 8'657 on 8/22/2010. The volumes eftah Division of
sand and water pumped in each stage can be found on the attached wellbGif, Gas and Mining

schematic under stage 8 through stage 14. The well is currently produ t REof the Mancos and Mesaverde formations.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/21/2010

RECEIVED October 21,

iPI Well No: 43047388960000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAs0E DE2sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext UTELAND BUTTE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1591 FNL 0314 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/22/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

sPuD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco finished fracture treating seven remaining productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation. Plugs were drilled and recompletion activities Accepted by the

culminated with the landing of tubing at 8'657 on 8/22/2010. The volumes eftah Division of
sand and water pumped in each stage can be found on the attached wellbGif, Gas and Mining

schematic under stage 8 through stage 14. The well is currently produ t REof the Mancos and Mesaverde formations.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/21/2010

RECEIVED October 21,

iPI Well No: 43047388960000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAs0E DE2sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext UTELAND BUTTE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1591 FNL 0314 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/22/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

sPuD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco finished fracture treating seven remaining productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation. Plugs were drilled and recompletion activities Accepted by the

culminated with the landing of tubing at 8'657 on 8/22/2010. The volumes eftah Division of
sand and water pumped in each stage can be found on the attached wellbGif, Gas and Mining

schematic under stage 8 through stage 14. The well is currently produ t REof the Mancos and Mesaverde formations.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/21/2010

RECEIVED October 21,



October 21, 2010October 21, 2010

LEASE: UTU-013429 WELL#: UtclandFederul42-11-10-18
FIELD: Riverbend
LOCATION: SENESecilTLOSRISE
COUNTY: IJmieli SI: AN: 43a7.38896

CONDUCTOR GL: 49313
SIZE: 16" I I KB:
WTIGRD: SPUD DATE:
WT/GRD: COMP DATE:
CSA: 60' i
SX:
CIRC: Ÿ ¡
TOC: Suri i i DATE FIRST PRODUCED 10/10/08
HOLE SIZE: 24" PRODUCTION METHOD llow

CHOKE SIZE 10
SURFACECASING CsgPRESSURE 3848

SIZE: 8 5/8" OIL (BBL) 0
WT/GRD: J-SS GAS (MCF) 152
WT/GRD: 32# WATER (BBL) $36
CSA: 3,349
SX: II3tisxclassu

274jts 2 3Æ" 4.70 P-110 TBG

BOLE SIZE: L. 114 landed @8,657 (8/22/10)

PRODUCTION CASING
SIZE: 4 1/2"
WT/GRD: P-110
WT/GRD: 13.1#
CSA: i4.193
SX: 899 sx Llass U

lid3sxbUISOVozG
CIRC:
TOC: InsideSuri
HOLE SIZE: I //8"

Sthanistime

Stage 14: R slick water wl1179 1W aissii exud, 46dil#

7/14/20 10 WSBwhite smud. 142BM 30/56 rusLa casted,
172bbl FRSW(Cin2}

Stagel3: R.IIckwaterwitaza#lsilmeshand,41062#

7/l4/20 LO elsewhite sand, 8405# 30/58 resin conted,1081
bl FRSW(Cla2)

Et i @

bbi FRSW(CIm2) 9403-07
9444-48 Slage 13 - Upper Mesaverde

I 9496·500
Stage I I: silck water wl 1785#1W meshsand, 63249#

7/14/2010 ersewlinesand,1134W30tsoreduconsed' 10096-100
443bblFRSW(Cinz) 10161.65 Singel>Upper/LmscrMewier

10182-86

Stage 10: R suck water si 1554# toomesh ..nd, 55171#
- = 10230-32

7/13/20 10 whitu smud, 6090# 311/SBmsin comied, 1351
bl FRSW(Cla2)

- - LO268-71 Etage 11 - Lower Mesaverde
- [0315-15

Stanc 9: FR sikk water w/ 1848# 1W mtsh mand,65222# 10353-55
7/13/2010 bbl.¾ d,7200#3WSBresIncnated,1574

3
Stagel0-l.uwerMesayerile

10353-55

Stage 8: FR miick weser wi 1932s Iso mesh sand, 6935m 10840-42
7/13/2010 3Œ50 while land, 765M 3&56 resin coated, 1718 10894-96

bbi FRSW(Cla2}
- = 10906-08

- 10932-34 Stage 9 - lower Mesaverde

I = 10987-89
Stage 7: Hybrid frac well wiß,iau# 1W mesh sand.

10/7/2008
132,3eeM2eMuVerssprop,2,441bbisXL-BHT

- 11243-46
= li286-89
- 11326-29 Singen Desert/Grung

Stage 6: Pump 1,000 gal 7.5% HCL aciiL FR silck = 11396-98
10/7/2008 waterfuneargeitracweilwl69,600#4erlePrbne = 11400-03 slaa.au.irm.grrvro

plus sand, 2,332 bbis FR slkk waterilinear gel

= 11918-26 Stage7-SpringCanyon
Stage 5: Pump 1,11011gal7.5% HCL Acid. FR slick
9/28/2008 wster/ilneergelfracweliwne,son#4erlePrime

plussend,4,745hbisFRslickwaterilineargel -- 12408-12 Stanch MN21
- = 12476-80 Staae 6 MN11

Stage 4: Pump 1,0119gni 7.5% HCL Acid. FR slick
- = [2992-96 Stage 5 - Erickson

9/25/2008 termnear fbmwen ska ePrime
-- 13006-10 13064-68 13088-92 StageS-Erickson

(jobcutskort)
= = 13145-49 Stage 1- Mancos

« - 13158-62 13171-75 13185-89 Stage l -Mances
Stage3: Pumpi,0D0gal7.5%HCLacidFRulick *= 13214-18 13224-28 Staat4-Mansos
9/24/2008 water/lineargelfrutwellw/55,00B#4DflePrime

pin. sand, 4,001 bbh FR slick waterinneerget i - 13336.40 13421-24 Stage 3 - Mances
- = 13430-34 13476-80 13493-97 Stage3-Mancos

Stagc2: Pump1,000mal7.5%HCLAcid.FRSIIch =- 13533-37 Stage2-4Iantos
9/24/2003 waterillacargelfrarweiw/62,70D#40/7ePrime a• 13559-63 13571-75 Stage2-3]anto,

Preparedt icvised by: Datc
M sU 10/14/2008¯37W2009

«I • 14,2 A PBTD 14,143' (10/8/118)
Ci W 8/13/2010 T

RECEIVED October 21,
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Ci W 8/13/2010 T
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M sU 10/14/2008¯37W2009

«I • 14,2 A PBTD 14,143' (10/8/118)
Ci W 8/13/2010 T
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API Well No: 43047388960000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-013429 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047388960000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UTELAND BUTTE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1591 FNL 0314 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

1/1/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in addition
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of

water from this well.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/31/2010

December 31, 2010

01/05/2011

iPI Well No: 43047388960000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEAs0E DE2sIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.
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4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

1591 FNL 0314 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SENE Section: 11 Township: 10.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
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CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,

iPI Well No: 43047388960000

FORM 9
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
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12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,



United States Department of the Interior 

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 
Utah State Office 

440 West 200 South, Suite 500 
Salt Lake City, UT 84101 

http://www.blrn.gov/ut/st/en.htrnl 
JUN 02 2014 

IN REPLY REFER TO: 

3180 (UTU90215X) 
UT9220000 

Mr. Brandon Casey 
Gasco Energy, Inc. N :l5"1'5 
7979 East Tufts Avenue, Suite 1150 
Denver, Colorado 80237 
un,-\- ~ B30 

Dear Mr. Casey: 

MAY 292014 
DlV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

Your application of May 8, 2014, filed with the Bureau of Land Management, Branch of Minerals, 
Salt Lake City, Utah, requests the designation of the River Bend Green River Enhanced Recovery 
Unit, embracing 2,480.68 acres located in Uintah County, Utah, as logically subject to operations 
under unitization provisions of the Mineral Leasing Act, as amended, and acceptance of the 
proposed form of unit agreement. 

Pursuant to unit plan regulations 43 CFR 3105, the land requested as outlined on your plat marked 
"Exhibit 'A' River Bend Green River Enhanced Recovery", Contract No. UTU90215X, is acceptable 
as a logical unit area for the purpose of enhanced recovery operations. 

The form of unit agreement and Exhibits "A", "B" and "C" as submitted with your application are 
acceptable. In the absence of any objections not now apparent, a duly executed agreement, identical 
with said form, will be approved if submitted in approvable status within a reasonable period of 
time. 

If you have any questions, please contact Judy Nordstrom of this office at (801) 539-4080. 

Sincerely, 

~L&a,b 
Roger L. Bankert 
Chief, Branch of Minerals 

cc: UDOGM 
SITLA 
BLM FOM - Vernal (UTGOl) w/enclosures 

United States Department of the Interior -.... ....

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
. Utah State Office RECEIVED440 West 200 South, Suite 500

Salt Lake City, UT 84101 JUN0 2 2014
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO: DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING
3180 (UTU90215X) Î $ Ë¾
UT9220000

Mr. Brandon Casey
Gasco Energy, Inc. NO
7979 East Tufts Avenue, Suite I 150
Denver, Colorado 80237

Dear Mr. Casey:

Your application of May 8, 2014, filed with the Bureau of Land Management, Branch of Minerals,
Salt Lake City, Utah, requests the designation of the River Bend Green River Enhanced Recovery
Unit, embracing 2,480.68 acres located in Uintah County, Utah, as logically subject to operations
under unitization provisions of the Mineral Leasing Act, as amended, and acceptance of the
proposed form of unit agreement.

Pursuant to unit plan regulations 43 CFR 3105, the land requested as outlined on your plat marked
"Exhibit 'A' River Bend Green River Enhanced Recovery", Contract No. UTU90215X, is acceptable
as a logical unit area for the purpose of enhanced recovery operations.

The form of unit agreement and Exhibits "A", "B" and "C" as submitted with your application are
acceptable. In the absence of any objections not now apparent, a duly executed agreement, identical
with said form, will be approved if submitted in approvable status within a reasonable period of
time.

If you have any questions, please contact Judy Nordstrom of this office at (801) 539-4080.

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals

cc: UDOGM
SITLA
BLM FOM - Vernal (UTG01)

United States Department of the Interior -.... ....

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
. Utah State Office RECEIVED440 West 200 South, Suite 500

Salt Lake City, UT 84101 JUN0 2 2014
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO: DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING
3180 (UTU90215X) Î $ Ë¾
UT9220000

Mr. Brandon Casey
Gasco Energy, Inc. NO
7979 East Tufts Avenue, Suite I 150
Denver, Colorado 80237

Dear Mr. Casey:

Your application of May 8, 2014, filed with the Bureau of Land Management, Branch of Minerals,
Salt Lake City, Utah, requests the designation of the River Bend Green River Enhanced Recovery
Unit, embracing 2,480.68 acres located in Uintah County, Utah, as logically subject to operations
under unitization provisions of the Mineral Leasing Act, as amended, and acceptance of the
proposed form of unit agreement.

Pursuant to unit plan regulations 43 CFR 3105, the land requested as outlined on your plat marked
"Exhibit 'A' River Bend Green River Enhanced Recovery", Contract No. UTU90215X, is acceptable
as a logical unit area for the purpose of enhanced recovery operations.

The form of unit agreement and Exhibits "A", "B" and "C" as submitted with your application are
acceptable. In the absence of any objections not now apparent, a duly executed agreement, identical
with said form, will be approved if submitted in approvable status within a reasonable period of
time.

If you have any questions, please contact Judy Nordstrom of this office at (801) 539-4080.

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals

cc: UDOGM
SITLA
BLM FOM - Vernal (UTG01)



River Bend Green River Enhanced Recover Unit 
Effective 1 September 2014 

Well Name Section TWN 
RBU6-20 2 100S 
RBU 13-20 2 l00S 
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 l00S 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 l00S 
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 l00S 
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 l00S 
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 
RBU 16-30 3 l00S 
RBU 15-30 3 l00S 
RBU8-100 10 100S 
RBU2-100 10 l00S 
RBU 1-100 10 100S 
RBU 5-110 11 100S 
RBU 10-110 11 100S 
UTELAND FEO 42-11-10-18 11 100S 
RBU 4-110 11 100S 
RBU2-110 11 100S 
RBU6-110 11 l00S 
RBU 12-120 12 100S 
RBU 3-120 12 l00S 

RNG APINwnber iType Status 
180E 4304731190 OW P 
180E 4304731280 OW P 
180E 4304737132 GW P 
180E 4304737338 GW P 
180E 4304737676 GW P 
180E 4304737677 GW P 
180E 4304738028 GW P 
180E 4304730129 OW S 
180E 4304731352 OW P 
180E 4304731539 OW P 
180E 4304731364 OW P 
180E 4304731 COo, OW P 
180E 4304734312 OW S 
180E 4304730409 OW P 
180E 4304731357 OW P 
180E 4304738896 GW P 
180E 4304730718 OW S 
180E 4304730826 OW S 
180E 4304731192 OW S 
180E 4304731651 OW P 
180E 4304733739 OW P 

1 5/1112015 

River Bend Green River Enhanced Recover Unit
Effective1 September 2014

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Nmnber Type Status
EUBU6-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 (IRT P
EUBU13-2DI 2 100S 180E 4304731280 Ol¥ P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 1005 180E 4304737676 GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737677 GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 GW P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 OW S
RIRJ16-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731352 ONV P
RERJ15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 ONV P
ICBUS-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731364 (IM/ P
RBU 2-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731 ( OW P
IUBLIl-10DI 10 100S 180E 4304734312 (IRT S
IUBUS-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730409 (IM/ P
FU3tl10-11[) 11 100S 180E 4304731357 ()?V P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S 180E 4304738896 GW P
IUBU4-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730718 OMT S
IUBLI2-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730826 Oi¥ S
IUBU6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 (IRT S
FU3tfl2-12D 12 100S 180E 4304731651 (TMT P
ILBU3-12D 1:2 1008 180E 4304733739 (TRT P

1

River Bend Green River Enhanced Recover Unit
Effective1 September 2014

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Nmnber Type Status
EUBU6-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 (IRT P
EUBU13-2DI 2 100S 180E 4304731280 Ol¥ P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 1005 180E 4304737676 GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737677 GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 GW P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 OW S
RIRJ16-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731352 ONV P
RERJ15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 ONV P
ICBUS-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731364 (IM/ P
RBU 2-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731 ( OW P
IUBLIl-10DI 10 100S 180E 4304734312 (IRT S
IUBUS-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730409 (IM/ P
FU3tl10-11[) 11 100S 180E 4304731357 ()?V P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S 180E 4304738896 GW P
IUBU4-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730718 OMT S
IUBLI2-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730826 Oi¥ S
IUBU6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 (IRT S
FU3tfl2-12D 12 100S 180E 4304731651 (TMT P
ILBU3-12D 1:2 1008 180E 4304733739 (TRT P

1



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only 

Effective Date· 4/16/2015 
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERA TOR: 
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265 
7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237 
303-996-1805 303-996-1805 

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV 

WELL INFORMATION: 
Well Name API 
See Attached List 

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION: 
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015 
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015 
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143 

REVIEW: 
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: 
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015 
4. OPS/SIITA welles) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1120/2016 
5. VIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A 
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None 
7. Inspections ofPA statelfee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION: 
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 

2. Indian welles) covered by Bond Number: 
3.State/fee welles) covered by Bond Number(s): 

DATA ENTRY: 

1. Welles) update in the OGIS on: 

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 

3. Unites) operator number update in OGIS on: 
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: 
5. StatelFee welles) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION: 

SUR0027842 
N/A 
SUR0027845 
SUR0035619 -FCB 

1122/2016 
1122/2016 
1122/2016 
N/A 
1122/2016 
N/A 

N/A 
6/2/2015 

N/A 

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division 
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1122/2016 
COMMENTS: 

1/22/2016 

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265
7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237
303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUROO27842
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUROO27845

SUROO35619-FCB

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 1/22/2016
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 1/22/2016
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016
COMMENTS:



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

Well Name -
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 

-------
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 
FEDERAL 31-21 G-9-19 
Federal 323-29-9-19 
Federal 421-29-9-19 
Federal 322-29-9-1 9 
Federal 43 1 -29-9-1 9 
Federal 432-29-9-1 9 
Federal 414-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 

.. _--

-----_._- -
federal 321-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 
Federal 212-29-9-19 
State 321-32-9-19 
State 423-32-9-19 
State 421-32-9-19 
State 413-32-9-1 9 
State 323-32-9-1 9 
State 431-32-9-19 ---
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 

-
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-1 0-1 7 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-1 1-16 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 

-----
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 
SQUA W CROSSING U 5 
RBU 5-lID -
FEDERAL 7-25A 

Section 
18 
17 
18 
29 
20 
21 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
36 
36 
36 
30 
29 
23 
26 
19 
17 
21 
32 
20 
17 
19 
32 
4 
32 
29 
16 
16 
29 
8 
16 
20 
20 
4 
22 
24 
2 
11 

------

25 

TWN 'RNG API Number Enti!Y 
090S 190E 4304752496 
090S 190E 4304752522 
090S 190E 4304752538 ' 
090S 190E 4304752544 

. '.' 

090S 190E 4304752545 
090S 190E 4304752546 
090S 190E 4304753026 
090S 190E 4304753027 
090S 190E 4304753029 ; 
090S 190E 4304753030 
090S 190E 4304753031 i 
090S 190E 4304753070 
090S 190E 4304753073 
090S 190E 4304753076 
090S 190E 4304753078 
090S 190E 4304753079 , 
090S 190E 4304753080 
090S 190E 4304753133 1 
090S 190E 4304754479 
090S 190E 4304754480 
090S 190E 4304754481 
090S 190E 4304754482 ! 

090S 190E 4304754483 
090S 190E 4304754529 
090S 180E 4304754541 
090S 180E 4304754542 
090S 180E 4304754543 
090S 190E 4304753012 19650 
100S 170E 4301333098 15941 
090S 190E 4304736915 16556 
090S 180E 4304738573 17201 
090S 190E 4304739777 18344 
O9OS 190E 4304739800 17202 
1I0S 150E 4301332391 13787 
100S 170E 4301332447 14033 
1l0S 150E 4301332475 14417 
100S 170E 4301332560 -14726 
1l0S 160E 4301332611 14439 
100S ,170E 4301332619 15649 
11 OS 170E 4301332674 15537 

' 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 
100S 170E 4301332679 14033 
1I0S 150E 4301332685 16082 
100S 170E 4301332730 15243 
100S 170E 4301332773 15370 
1I0S 170E 4301332778 14802 
1I0S 160E 4301332888 15098 
100S 170E 4301333081 15714 
100S 1 70E '4301333087 i 15807 
11 OS 170E 4301333099 ' 15920 
1I0S 140E 4301333437 16919 
1I0S ,140E 4301333443 16367 
100S 180E 4304730129 16266 
100S ! 180E 4304730409 9005 

I 

090S 180E I4304730624 19030 

Mineral Surface Type Status 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal 'GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 

---
Federal Federal GW APD 
'Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
Federal Federal GW DRL 

--

Federal Federal GW OPS 
Fee Fee GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal ,GW OPS 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P ---
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Eederal GW P 

.. -

Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State 'OW P 
Federal Federal OW P --
Federal Federal OW P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

WellName Section TWN RNGAPINumber Entity Mineral Surface TypeiStatus
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304752522 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752538 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304752544 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304752545 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304752546 Federal Federal OW APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753026 Federal_ Federal GW APD
Federa1421-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753027 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753029 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1431-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753030 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753031 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1414-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753070 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753073 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753076 Federal Federal GW APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753078 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753079 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753080 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753133 Federal Federal GW APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754479 State State GW APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754480 State State GW APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754481 State State GW APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754482 State State GW APD

te 323-32-9-19 32 0908 190E 4304754483 State State GW APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754529 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754541 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754542 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754543 State State GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 1108 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State_ State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-l l-17 4 110S 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-ll-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 l10S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 l10S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW P
RBU 5-11D 11 l00S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU6-2D 
NGC 33-18J 
RBU 13-2D 

2 
18 
2 

-.-------~--~~----~~--

RBU 16-3D 3 
-----

RBU 1O-1lD 11 
RBU 8-10D 10 
RBU 15-3D 3 
RBU 12-12D 12 
RBU2-10D 10 
RBU 3-15D 15 
RBU 3-12D 12 

--

STATE 7-36A 36 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 
STATE4-32B 32 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 
L YTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 

--

FED 11-21-9-19 21 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 

- -

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 

----
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 

-~ ~--

DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 

--
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 

- --_._--

DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 

-
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 

100S 180EI4304731190 7075 State State OW P 
090S 190E:4304731200 16155 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180Ei4304731280 16267 State State OW P 

----

100S 180E 14304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 1180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 

-+-- ---- c----
100S 1180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
100S ~~304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180EI4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 14304731801 110784 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW IP 
090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 14304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734169 14140 'Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734202 113455 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P 
100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170EI4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734607 :13640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E:4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P 

-~ 

090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735405 114928 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW IP 
090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E!4304735623 i 14640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P 
090S 190E4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P 
100S 180E'4304735808 !15592 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 190E 4304735844 114356 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P 
090S 190E 14304736093 i 14976 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P ---f----

090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P 
090S 180E!4304736220 14763 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P +---
090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P 
090S 190E '4304736271 115884 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P 

---
090S 190E !4304736442 .15715 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E ;4304736600 ! 14977 Federal Federal GW P 
090S I 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW ,P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU6i-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State ONV P
14GiC33-18J 18 090S 190E ‡304731200 6155 Federal Federal DNV P
FU3U13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State CA¥ P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
FU3tJ 10-111) 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal ()VV P
FU3t] 8-10L) 10 100S 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal ()?V JP
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU2-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federed Federed Cygr p
IUBU3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federed Federed CA¥ P
FU3U3-12D 12 100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federed Federal OMT P
STATE7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 Sutte Smte GMT P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFLAL23-29#l 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FE]D44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federed (ITV P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FEI342-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GYV P
PETESM'ASH23-12#1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federed Federal GNV P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FEl3 14-18-2 #1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Fedenal Federal GB¥ P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FEI3 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GVV P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFDAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Fedenal Feden11 GMT P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEE)EFLAL41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Feden11 (39V P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P
LikNIB TItUST24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GMT P
FEEIEftAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E =‡304735808 15592 Federal Federal (39V P
FEDERAL21-6-10-19 6 100S 190E 4304735844 14356 Federed Federed GNV P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STitTE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GVV P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEEIEftAL23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 43047369‡42 15715 Federal Federal (svV P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 
-----

FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 
~HEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 -----_ .. _. __ ._--

FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 

--

----------.. -------

----_. __ . __ ._----_._._._._ .... -

FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 
----------

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 

125 090S 180E i4304736727 '15475 Federal Federal 
--

30 090S 190E'4304736739 !15476 Federal Federal 
-------
25 090S 180E'4304736740 15213 Federal Federal 
19 090S 190E 14304736771 

-----

15355 Federal Federal 
-- , -

~L ____ f?90S :180EI4304736772 15338 Federal Federal 
f-----'---+---

30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal 
--

22 090S 190E 14304736913 15187 Fee Fee 
- -- ------- - -- ----f-------

LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E:4304736916 : 17012 Fee Fee --_._----

DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180Ei4304737115 115011 State State 
.... __ .. _._---_.--- -_ .. --------

FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 '090S .190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal 

.--------- -- 1--

UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 14304737132 15087 i State State 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E i4304737338 ! 15365 State State 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E :4304737611 116311 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S i 190E!4304737612 16051 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 119OE[4304737613 16052 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S '190E:4304737621 16253 !Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E I4304737622 16264 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E :4304737630 16557 Federal Federal 
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E

'
4304737631 15961 Federal Federal 

~ 

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 1180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S : 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E !430473767616254 iState State 

----

180E4304737677h5806 State UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S State 
---- c---

UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S ,180E'4304738028 16868 State State 
-- 1-----

FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S ',190E 4304738336 116467 Federal Federal 
1-------

190E 4304738337 116119 IFederal Federal FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S --------------f-----

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E4304738351 16884 Federal Federal 
--- -

180E~4304738352 ~~ WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 16349 Federal Federal _.-----

SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E [4304738353 16210 Federal Federal 
-

FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S : 190E 4304738407 ; 16236 Federal Federal 
--

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E!4304738465 16558 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180EI4304738469 16449 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal 
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S ,190E 4304738673 : 15832 Fee Fee 
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S 180E4304738896 16792 Federal Federal 
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E:4304739170 16309 State State 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S : 190EI4304739171 16308 State State 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 1 190E 4304739172 116310 State State 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E!4304739717 17054 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E,4304739729 17241 Federal Federal -
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 ! 17266 Federal Federal 

. -------. 
4304739773 -: 17013 ,Federal DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E Federal .... -.--_ ..... -

FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E4304740233 17014 Federal Federal 
- - - -

FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E:4304751280 18211 Federal Federal ---------------c------ c---
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190Ei4304751281 18210 Federal Federal 

----f----
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S : 190E 4304752870_1~64? IFederal Federal -------------------r--------- c----

~~~~~~ !;~:~~:~:! ~ 30 090S 190E14304752872 19648 Federal Federal --_ .. __ .. 
30 090S 190E ;4304753011 19649 Federal Federal 

- --1----------
180E 14304753324 '19783 Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S State State 

Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 : 180E 14304753325 36 090S 19783 State State 
--- --

Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S '180E 4304753326 19747 State State 
Desert SI>ring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E '4304753327 119747 State State 

-- _ ... 

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E :4304753328 119783 State State 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S i 170E 4301332677 ! 15144 State State 
RBU 4-11D III 100S 180E :4304730718 16269 Federal Federal 

GW P 
--

GW P 
-~-. 

GW P 
GW P 
GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
----c------
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

--

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

-------

GW ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,P 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW iP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
-----

GW P 
GW P 

----

GW P 
---

OW P 
OW P 
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

- --
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW :S 
OW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-l l-10-18 11 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State_ GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
RBU4-llD ll 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU2-llD 
~---- --
RBU 6-llD 
STATE2-32B c--
STATE 9-36A 
FEDERAL 13-30B 
STATE 13-36A 
FEDERAL 16-26A 

II ._-- -------

II 
32 

1

36 
30 

-----~---

36 
126 

------------------+-----

FEDERAL 31-29 129 
RBU I-IOD :10 ----------------------_.- I 

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 i 18 

100S 180E 4304730826 116270 Federal Federal OW S 
------- ------ 1-------

100S 180E4304731192 16271 .Federal Federal OW S -+---- --
090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 

-090S1180E 4304732225 il1364 
---

State State IGW S 
090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
090S il80E 4304733598 17838 State State IGW S 
090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
090S ! 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
100S 1180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW .S 
090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal iGW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-l lD 11 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S
STATE 2-32B 32 '090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE 9-36A 36 _ _090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significanUy deepen existing wells below current boItom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drlH horizontal laterals. Use APPLlCA TION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for sUCh proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OILWELL 0 GAS WELL IlJ OTHER __________ _ 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Gasco Production Company 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

7979 E. Tufts Ave. 

4. LOCATIONOFWELL 

CITY Denver 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL 

STATE CO zIP80237 

QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWJIISHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S 

I PHONE NUMBER: 

(303) 483-0044 

UTU-76482 
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UMT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18 
9. API NUMBER: 

4304737631 
10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: 

Uteland Butte 

COUNTY: Uintah 

STATE: 
UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

rlI 0 ACIDIZE 0 DEEPEN 0 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(SubmH in Duplicate) 0 ALTER CASING 0 FRACTURE TREAT 0 SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work wil start: 0 CASING REPAIR 0 NEW CONSTRUCTION 0 TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

4/16/2015 0 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE 0 TUBING REPAIR 

0 CHANGE TUBING 0 PLUG AND ABANDON 0 VENT OR FLARE 

0 SUBSEQUENT REPORT 0 CHANGE WELL NAME 0 PLUG BACK 0 WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

0 CHANGE WELL STATUS 0 PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) 0 WATER SHUT-OFF 
Date of work completion: 

0 COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS 0 RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 0 OTHER: 

0 CONVERT WELL TYPE 0 RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator 01:1 this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco 
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/1612015. 

Gasco Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

Badlands Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui ~ 15 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

(512000) 

TITLE 

DATE 

(See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

RECEIVED 
JUN 0 2 2015 

DIV OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

Engineering Tech 

511812015 

APPROVE 
JAN 22 2016 

~.oIL_ GAS & MINING ... 

BY:~Ch.Jt9 rn~cLU'\~ 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-76482

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill newwells,significantlydeepen exislingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TODRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL O GASWELL OTHER Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

7979 E. Tufts Ave CITY
Denver STATE CO ZIP 80237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL COUNTY: Uintah

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FR^CTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

4/16/2015 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUGAND ABANDON O VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME O PLUGBACK O WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) O WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE O OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly show allpertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on thiswell, in additionto thewells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effectivedate of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 1
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

Michael Decker, Exec. Vi President & COO !)EC61VEL
Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui 15 JUN0 2 205
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

DIVOFOiL,GAS&MINING
Michael Decker, Exec. Vic PreWent&COO

NAME (PLEASE PRIN Lindsey Cooke TITLE Engineering Tech

SIGNATURE DATE 5/18/2015

(Thisspacefo Stateuseonly) APPROVED
JAN2 2 2016

(5/2000) (seeinstruolinsonReverseSide) IV.OlL GAS &



Well Name Section TWN RNO API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal OW DRL 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal OW OPS 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 O9OS 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee OW OPS 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S lSOE 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal OW OPS 
OATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 II OS 150E 4301332391 13787 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332447 14033 State State OW P 
OATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 II OS 150E 4301332475 14417 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 lOOS 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 II OS 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332619 15649 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 4 llOS 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332676 15242 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 lOOS l70E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 llOS 150E 4301332685 16082 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 lOOS 170E 4301332730 15243 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 llOS l70E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 llOS 160E 4301332888 15098 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333087 15S07 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 II OS 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 II OS 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 II OS 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 5-IID II lOOS 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 O9OS 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU6-2D 2 lOOS 180E 430473ll9O 7075 State State OW P 
NOC33-18J 18 O9OS 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 13-20 2 lOOS 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P 
RBU 16-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU IO-IID II lOOS 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU8-IOD 10 l00s 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 15-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 12-120 12 lOOS lSOE 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU2-IOD 10 lOOS 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-15D 15 lOOS 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-12D 12 lOOS 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE7-36A 36 O9OS 180E 4304733741 14244 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 lOOS 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734ll1 13441 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 O9OS 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 O9OS 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal OW P 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 lOOS 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE4-32B 32 O9OS 190E 4304734314 14440 State State OW P 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 lOOS 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 lOOS l70E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal OW P 
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 lOOS lSOE 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 O9OS 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal OW P 

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKINRIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 1005 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 0905 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 1908 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED l2-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE 32-08 8 110S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
RBU5-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 6-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State OW P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P
RBU 16-3D 3 1005 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 8-10D 10 1005 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 1005 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 2-l0D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-12D 12 1005 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 0905 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 0908 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal GW P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GW P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 4-32B 32 0908 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FED 14-18-2#1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FED I 1-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 0905 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW



FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee OW P 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 lOOS 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 lOOS 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 41-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304735845 14639 State State OW P 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 O9OS 190E 4304735995 14871 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 23-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736219 14738 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 21-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736220 14763 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 12-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736233 14764 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 43-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736241 14992 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 O9OS 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 33-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304737115 15011 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 O9OS 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737132 15087 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737338 15365 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO FED 21-1-10-18 I l00s 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 I lOOS 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737676 16254 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737677 15806 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304738028 16868 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal OW P 

FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 0908 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 0903 190E 4304735732 144% Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 0908 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 1005 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 0908 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 0905 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 0905 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 0905 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 0905 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 1005 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 0905 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW



LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P 
UTELAND FED 42-1 1-10-18 II 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P 
STATE21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 Slale Stale GW P 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 Slale State GW P 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P 
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P 
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P 
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State Stale GW P 
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 Slate Slale GW P 
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P 
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P 
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 Slale Stale GW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S 
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 Slale Slale OW S 
RBU 4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU2-11D II 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S 
STATE 2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 Slale State GW S 
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S 
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
RBU 1-100 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S 
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW S 

LAMBTRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 1005 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 0905 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 43047397\7 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED I 1-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 I 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert SpringsState 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
DesertSpring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
SQUAW CROSSING US 2 1005 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW S
RBU4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Fedem! Fedeml ONV S
RBU2-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304730826 16270 Fedeml Fedeml CAV S
RBU6-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304731192 16271 Fedem! Fedeml OAV S
STATE2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 0905 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW
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