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Tel 435 781 4300 • Fax 435 781 4329

October 4, 2005

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 W. N. Temple STE 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

To Whom It May Concern:

In reference to the State Oil and Gas Conservation rule R649-3-3 QEP Uinta
Basin, Inc. NBZ 8ML-31-8-24 is an exception to this rule due to topography.

There are no additional lease owners within 460' of the proposed location. If you
have any question please contact Jan Nelson @(435) 781-4331.

Thank you,

Jan Nelson

RECFIVED
DCTO5 2005

D CIL,GAS&



FORM APPROVED

Form 3160-3 OMBNO. 1040-0136
(July1992) UNITED STATES SUBMITINTRIPLICATE* Expires:February28,1995

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-77301

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN NIA

TYPE OF WORK 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
DRILL DEEPENO BIG VALLEY UNIT # UTU-81308X

TYPE OF WELL 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.

O O SINGLE MULTIPLE
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Contact: Jan Nelson 9.API NUMBER:
QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. E-Mail: jan.nelson@questar.com

3. ADDRESS Telphone number 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
11002 E. 17500 S. Vernal, Ut 84078 Phone 435-781-4331 Fax 435-781-4323 UNDESIGNATED

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*) 11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEYOR AREA
At Surface 1581' FNL 1233' FEL SENE, SECTION 31, TSS, R24E
At proposed production zone SEC.31 T8S R24E Mer SLB

14. DISTANCE IN MILES FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POSTOFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARIS 13. STATE
34 + I - SOUTHEAST OF VERNAL, UTAH Uintah UT
15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION TO NEAREST 16.NO.OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(also to nearest drig,unit line if any) 1505.46 40

1233' +/-

18.DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BLMIBIA Bond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, R

9000'
ESBOOOO24

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.) 22. DATE WORK WILL START 23. Estimated duration
5081.2' GR ASAP 10 days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:
1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an exisiting bond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan Item 20 above).
3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is on National Forest System Lands, 5. Operator certification.

the SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office) 6. Such other site specific informationand/or plans as may be required by the
O Î authorized officer.

SIGNED Name (printedItyped) Jan Nelson DATE October 3, 2005

TITLE Regulatory Affairs

(This space for Federal or State office use)

PERMITNO. 'Û 7' APPROVAL DATE
Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant hol any egal equitable titleto those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon

CONDITIONS ROVAL, :

BRADLEYG. HILL
APPROVED BY TITLE ENVIRONMENTALSCIENTISTIII DATE

*See Instructions On Reverse EIVED
I•1United SSea

a

n1001, ma es it ascrime for anentse o ao t oradgency of



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
RR T8S R24E SL B.&M Well location, NBZ #8ML-31-8-24, located23 24 * * • • • as shown in the SE 1/4 NE 1/4 of Section
E E 31, T8S, R24E, S.L.B.&M. Uintoh County, Utah.

NB944'47"W - 2561.JJ' (Meas.) NB9°51'13"W
- 2640.98' (Meas.) l'A'i'o'n ne or BASIS OF ELEVATION

'ists Bross cap *
1918 eross cop i No Cap

BENCH MARK 45EAM LOCATED IN THE NW 1/4 SW 1/4 OFHigh, Stee/ O.J' High SECTION 6, T9S, R24E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE BONANZA,
QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAIDLot 1 ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 5350 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.NBZ f8ML-31-8-24 - W

Elev. Ungraded Ground = 5082'
,1233

Lot 2

N

3 1916 Brass Cap
1.2' High on1916 Bross CoP
Stee/ Post b o0.5' High, Steel

O 6 O

Lot 3
SCALE

CERTIFICAT
THISIS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE AB gi¾ FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVE ,<BYWlO Y
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE S TRUE AND THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAN

Lot 4 EGIST RED su vo

S T

RBS UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINGR9S N89°52'W
- 2564.10' (G.L.O.) N89'55'W - 2645.94' (G.L.O.) 85 SOUTH ß00 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

(435) 789-1017(AUTONOMOUDNAD 83)LEGEND: LATITUDE= 40°04'55.36"
(40.082044) SCALE1"

= 1000'
DA S-UORVEYED DA DMO

05=
90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109°15'06.53"

(109.251814) PARTY REFERENCES(AUTONOMOUDNAD 27) D.A. T.A. L.K. G.L.O. PLAT= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE= 40°04'55.48" (40.082078) WEATHER FILEA = SECTIONCORNERSLOCATED. LONGITUDE= 109°15'04.10"
(109.251139) HOT QUESTAR EXPLR. &



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
Well location, NBZ #8ML-31-8-24, locotedRR TBS R24E, S.L.B.&M. as shown in the SE 1/4 NE 1/4 of Section23 24 '
31, Tas, R24E, S.LB.&M. Uintoh County, Utah.E E

r.swr ao•r BASIS OF ELEVATIONN69'44'47"W - 2561.JJ' (Meas.) NB9'5173"W - 2640.98' (Meas.) », sad a,te
gets auss av '

'ists an., y
' ' " * BENCH MARK 45EAM LOCATEDIN THE NW 1/4 SW 1/4 OFf.6° Mgr SfW Af Mph SECTION6, TOS, R24E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE BONANZA,Post

QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAHCOUNTY, 7.5 MINUTEQUAD.(TOPOGRAPHICMAP) PUßUSHED BY THE UNITED STATESDEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR,GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAIDIst 1 ELEVATIONIS MARKEDAS BEING 5350 FEET.
BASIS OF BEARINGS

BASIS OF BEARINGSIS A G.P.S. OSSEÑVATION.NBZ /8ML-- J1-8-24
OK Urtgraded Ground =

Ist 2 460-ft R
N

400-ft
window 1916 &nse Cqq

Ints
SCALE

CERTIFICATE
1HiS 15 TO CERTIFYTHAT THE ABOVE s¶RW
FIELDNOTESOF ACTUALSURSEYS ME

UTU-TTSD1 UTUN7301 SUPERVISIONAND THATTHE SAME E AND 3HE80/2000 WAV2008 BEST OF MY KNOMEOGEAND •,

EP 100.00% GEP100.00%

RM t' '
Unrran ENGØlEERING &

R9S NS9'52'W - 2564.10' (G,LO UTU-T/00
NBZ8NL 85 SOUTH 200 BAST - VERNAI. UTA11 84078

'myn (436) 789-1017

LEGEND:
-

- 1000' a-
90 SYMBOL

(AUTONOMOUDNAD 27) D.A. T.A. L.K. G.L.O.PLAT= PROPOSED WELLHEAD· LATITUDE= 40'04'55.48 (40.082078) WEATHER FN.EA = SECTIONCORNERSI.OCATED. LONGilUDE- 109'15'04.10" (109.251139) HOT GUESTAR EXPLR. &



Additional Operator Remarks

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. proposes to drill a well to 9000' to test the MesaVerde. If productive, casing
will be run and the well completed. Ifdry, the wellwillbe plugged and abandoned as per BLM and
State of Utah requirements"

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated
fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 and 24 East.

See attached Onshore No. 1

See attached notice of intent to complete into multiplepools.

Please be advised that QEP Uinta Basin Inc. agrees to be responsible under the terms and
conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No.ESBOOOO24. The principal is QEP Uinta Basin
Inc. via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR



O O
NOTICE OF INTENT TO COMPLETE INTOMULTIPLE POOLS

NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

In compliance withthe stated objectives of section R649-3-22 of the Utah Administrative Code
and the Utah Oil and Gas Conservation Act, Questar Exploration and Production Company
hereby requests the commingling of production between intervals in the NBZ 8ML-31-8-24.
Questar considers this commingling to be in the public interest in that it promotes maximum
ultimate economic recovery, prevents waste, provides for orderly and efficient production of oil
and gas and presents no detrimental effects from commingling the twogas streams.

Questar requests approval for the commingling between the Mesa Verde and Wasatch intervals.
As the well is not in a Unit PA and the ownership is the same between formations, production will
be reported as combined Mesa Verde / Wasatch production.

This wellwill be completed using multiplestage hydraulic fracturing. Bridge plugs will be used to
isolate completion intervals during fracturing operations and will be drilled up prior to putting the
well on production. Mesa Verde and Wasatch intervals will be fractured separately, except where
theyoccur too close togetherto make isolation unfeasible.

A plat of all contiguous owners willfollow along with an affidavitstating that all contiguous owners
have been notified and given a 15 day objection period.

Mike Stahl
Completion Engineer
Questar Exploration &
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AFFIDAVIT OF NOTICE

STATE OF COLORADO )
COUNTY OF DENVER ) ss:

Angela Page, being duly sworn, deposes and says:

1. That I am employed by QuestarMarket Resources in the capacity as a
Landman. My business address is Independence Plaza

1050 17 h Street, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265

2. In my capacity as a Landman, pursuant to the provisions of Utah
Administrative Rule 615-3-22 I have provided a copy of QuestarMarket
Resource's application for completion of the NBZ 8ML-31-8-24 well into two
or more pools, in the form of Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining's Form 9
Sundry Notice, to owners of all contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units
overlying the pools which are the subject of that application.

3. In my capacity as a Landman I am authorized to provide such notice of
QuestarMarket Resource's application to contiguous owners and to make this
affidavit on this 27th day of July, 2005.

Printe Name: Ange a Page

The foregoing instrument was sworn t and subscribed before me this Ñ] day of

Notary Public
'

• •
·

MyCommission



BZ 4ML-31-8-24 NBZ 2ML-31-8-24o ©
NBZ 8ML-31-8-24NBZ 24

UUI33-001-00
UTU-77301
Exp 6/30/2008
QEP 100.00%

Sec 31, T8S-R24E

1000 0 1000 ft
I........,r i

1:12000

TwlKmv40-acre pool COMMINGLED PRODUCTION

Commingledwell
WU ta Basin-Ontah County,-

- 4,
NBZ 4ML-31-8-24,
NBZ 6ML-31-8-24,

BigValleyUnitboundary NBZ 8ML-31-8-24
Lease: UTU-77301

OffESEGR Geologist: JDHerman Landman:AngelaPage
. .. . .. Lease IinB Exploration and am v.wiamProduction

lose um st,a soo converco se2es Date:August 16, 2005 05722\MapstUtahmaps\Comm 2005\31824
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Clep Uinta Basin, Inc.
NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

ONSHORE OIL&GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditionswillbe furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth
Uinta Surface
Green River 1730'
Wasatch 4220'
Mesa Verde 6460'
TD 9000'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil, Gas, Water and Other Mineral Bearinq Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Oil/Gas Mese Verde 9000'

Allfresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling,willbe
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

Allwater shows and water-bearing sands willbe reported to the BLMin Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. Ifno flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLMalong with any water analyses conducted.

3. Anticipated Bottom Hole Pressures

Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 3903.0



QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

1581' FNL 1233' FEL
SENE, SECTION 31, T8S, R24E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-77301

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI - POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

An onsite inspection was conducted for the NBZ 8ML-31-8-24 on September 22, 2005. Weather conditions were
clear and sunny at the timeof the onsite. In attendance at the inspection were the following individauls:

Paul Buhler Bureau of Land Management
Amy Torres Bureau of Land Management
Jan Nelson QEP Uinta Basin Inc.

1. Existinq Roads:

The proposed well site is approximately 34 miles southeast of Vernal, Utah.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads withina 2 - mile radius.

No improvements willbe made to existing acces road.

2. Planned Access Roads:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated
fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 - Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.

4. Location of Existinq & Proposed Facilities:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated
fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.
Need to bury pipeline where it crosses flood plain.
QEP requests a surface pipeline based on the following justificationincluded in the
attached "Request for
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5. Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated
fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

6. Source of Construction Materials:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated
fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated
fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated
fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

9. Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills
and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailerparking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads.

A pit liner is required. A felt pit liner willbe required if bedrock is encountered.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated
fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Interim Reclamation

Please see attached Interim Reclamation plan.

Once the well is put onto production, QEP willreclaim as much of the well pad as possible that willallow
for operations to continue in a safe and reasonable manner. Reseeding will be done in the spring or fall
of every year to allowwinter precipitationto aid in the succuss of
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Seed Mix:

Interim Reclamation:
6 Ibs Hycrest Crested Wheatgrass
6 Ibs Indian Rice Grass
Final Reclamation:
Seed Mix# 1 3 Ibs. Fourwing Saltbush, 4 lbs. Hycrest Crested Wheat Grass, 3 Ibs. Indian Rice Grass and
1 Ibs. Needle & Thread Grass.

11. Surface Ownership:
Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4400

12. Other Information

A Class IIIarchaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology
Consultants. A copy of this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by
Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended
for this location.

A class Illpaleontological survey was conducted by Intermountain Paleo Consulting. A copy of
this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by Stephen D. Sandau.
The inspection resulted in the location of no fossil resources. However, if vertebrate fossil(s) are found
during construction a paleontologist should be immediately notified. QEP will provide paleo monitor if needed.

No drilling or construction willtake place during the Pronghorn season May 10 thruJune 20th.

There is a Burrowing Owl Stipulation from April 1st to August 15th. No construction or drilling will
commence during this period unless otherwise determined by a wildlifebiologist that the site is inactive.

Please install low water crossing where it crosses major drainage. Keep access road out of flood
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QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.

Request for Exception to Buried Pipeline
for

NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

QEP respectfully requests an exception to burying this pipeline. We understand the
standard Condition of Approval (COA) that may be included in the approved Application
for Permit to Drill (APD) is: "As a Best Management Practice (BMP), the pipeline would
be buried within the identified construction width of an access corridor that contains the
access road and pipelines. The construction width for the access corridor would
increase from30 feet,by an additional 20 feet,to a total of 50 feet.Exceptions to this
BMP may be granted where laterally extensive, hard indurated bedrock, such as
sandstone, is at or within 2 feet of the surface; and, soil types with a poor history of
successful rehabilitation. " QEP will install the pipeline within the access corridor and
will avoid cross-country installation when possible. Our reason for requesting a surface
line is based on the following justification:

Class IV VRM

+ This area's designated Visual Resource Management is classified as Class IV. The
Class IV objective is to provide for management activities that require major
modification to the existing character of the landscape. The level of change to the
landscape can be high. The management activities may dominate the view and may
be the major focus of the viewer attention. However, every attempt should be made
to minimize the impact of these activities through careful location, minimal
disturbance, and repetition of the basic visual elements of form, line, color, and
texture.

+ QEP feels that surface pipe will comply with this classification more so than buried
pipe due to the amount of surface disturbance that will be required to bury it. We
believe surface installation within the access corridor will minimize the disturbance
so that the pipeline does not dominate the view.

Environmental and Safety Concerns

+ Buried pipe will greatly increase surface disturbance and habitat fragmentation.
The soil in this area has a poor history of successful rehabilitation. Buried pipe
will have an increased corrosion rate and would need to be dug up for repairs or
replacement; the constant surface disturbance will not allow time for successful
reclamation.

+ Increasing surface disturbance will greatly increase noxious and invasive weed



BLM - VFO - 2 - 10/3/2005

+ With the increased corrosion rate, buried pipe may have undetectable leaks that
could go unnoticed for months. Small leaks may turn into large plumes of
underground hazards because they are not easily monitored and not seen right
away. An undetected leak also increases the potential for explosive incidents.
Once detected, the surface will need to be disturbed, once again, to dig up the line
and replace or repair it.

+ Accidents associated with pipe breaks during construction activities could
increase substantially as the number of buried lines increases.

* The additional surface disturbance will increase the risk of disturbing
paleontological sites.

Operational and Mechanical Concerns for Gas Lines

+ Cathodic protection will be required for buried pipe. Cathodic protection requires
anode beds that must be maintained. This will add substantial costs in labor and
material. Additional power lines will need to be installed to the anode beds. The
additional costs for equipment and labor will be approximately $50,000.00per
section.

+ Pipeline markers need to be used with buried pipe. This¾ill add costs in labor
and material.

+ Every tie in requires a valve. The average distance between valves is
approximately ¼ mile. Valves will have to be placed in "freeze boxes" or "valve
boxes". Valve boxes will be considered confined space vhich increases the
manpower needed to repair or rèplade válves. Everý välÝebox will also require
bright yellow guard rails.

+ Additional equipment required for buried pipe can include blades/dozers,
trenchers (cutting or blasting in hard rock), side booms, etc. which increases
installation costs.

+ Buried pipe must have fusion bonded epoxy (FBE) coating. FBE pipe will cost
an additional $2.00per foot compared to bare pipe.

+ This pipeline has the potential for being upgraded/upsized to a larger pipe
diameter depending oli production volumes. If upsizing is required, the pipe will
need to be dug up which will cause additional surface disturbance and will not
allow adequate time for successful reclamation.

+ Surface lines are sometimes relocated to accommodate new locations; this is done
in an effort to minimize the amount of pipe rieeded and the amount of surface
disturbed. If this pipe is buried, this will no longer be an



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
INTERIM RECLAMATION PLAN FOR

'S NBZ #8ML-31-8-24
SECTION 31, T8S, R24E, S.L.B.&M.

1581' FNL 1233' FEL

SCALE: 1" = 50'
DATE: 09-07--05

Drawn By L.K.

GAS UNIT

Production Tanks

OWELLHEAD

Access
Rooo'

INTERIMRECLAMATION
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (485)
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Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

Jan Nelson
Red Wash Rep.

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4331

Certification:

AIIlease and/or unitoperations willbe conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made withall applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil &Gas Orders, the approved

plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

QEP Uinta Basin Inc. will be fully responsible for the actions of theirsubcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drillwillbe furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all

construction and drilling operations.

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently

exist; that the statementsmade in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein willbe

performed by QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. it's contractors and subcontractors
in conformitywith this plan and the termsand conditions under which it is approved. This
statement is subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

03 Oct-05

/ J elson Date
Red Wash
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

NBZ #8ML-31-8-24
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 31, T8S, R24E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHWESTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: EASTERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATIONPHOTOS 08 05 05 PHOTO
85 South 200 East Vernal,Utah 84078 NT DAY YEAR

- sine _ 435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com i TAKENBY:DA. DRAWNBY:LK. ISED:



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PRO FIGURE #1
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR
NBZ #8ML-31-8-24

SECTION31, T8S, R24E, S.L.B.&M.
1581' FNL 1233' FEL

Approx.
Top of C-0.2

C-4.7' / Cut Slope E/. 81.4'

E/. 85.9'

48'
y C-4.0' Sta. J+50

/ E/. 85.2
SCALE: 1" = 50'
DATE: 08-08-05 Round Corners

os NeededNOTEDrawn By L.K.

F/ore Pit is to be /ocated
a min. of 100' from the /
Wel/ Head.

Existing PIPE TUBS
Droinage

Pit Topsoil PIPE RACKS Diit

- J S' I
C- 1.0

c I ~ 48' 150' Sta. 1+75
E/. 86. O' 7 O'C-16.8' TOILET O E-0.6'

-,I
- E/. 84.4' Tim

L UGHT PLANT

PUMP HOUSE
C PRES OR WANTER

BOOSTER

Total s'it Capacity . ---.-

W/2' of Freeboard
= 10,620 Ob/s. ± Sta. 0 51 -----

TR SH

- J.6' E-4.4'
Existing C-7. J ??' L4e s. my sto. 0+00
Drainage (htm. pit)

Approx- Proposed Access E/. 75.2
Toe of RoadNO TES.·
Fill Slope

Elev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Stoke = 5082.2'
UINTAH ENGINEERING oc LAND SURVEYING

F/N/SHED GRADE ELEM AT LOC. STAKE =5081.2 es s,. zoo ,,,, . y,,.... eg., 4407, . 4,,,



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PRO FIGURE #2
. TYPICALCROSS SECTIONS FORX-Section

scale NBZ #8ML-31-8-24
¯

,, , SECTION 31, T8S, R24E, S.L.B.&M.
1 = 50

1581' FNL 1233' FEL
DATE: 08-08-05

Drawn By L.K.

48' 150'
c nstruction

SM. J+50

10' y 70' 48' 150°

..
....

Location Stoke

SM. 1+75

10' 70' 48' 150'

S/ope = 1 1/2:/
c5 (Typ.)

SM. 0+51

48' 150'

Finished Grade

·¯¯¯¯ ¯~ SM . 0+ 00
* NO TE:

F/LL QUANT/TY /NCLUDES
5X FOR COMPACTIONAPPROXIMATE YARDAGES Excess Material = 4,400 Cu. Yds.

CUT Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 3,140 Cu. Yds.
(12") Topsoil Stripping = 1,700 Cu. Yds· (1/2 Pit Vol.)
Remaining Location = 6,110 Cu. Yds. EXCESS UNBALANCE = 1,260 Cu. Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 7,810 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)

FILL = J,410 CU.YDS. IIINTAH ENGINEERING & I,AND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435)
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SCALE:1" = 1000' DRAWNBY:LK. REVISED:



WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 10/05/2005 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-37238

WELL NAME: NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

OPERATOR: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. ( N2460 )

CONTACT: JAN NELSON PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4331

PROPOSED LOCATION:

SENE 31 OSOS 240E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SURFACE· 1581 FNL 1233 FEL· Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 1581 FNL 1233 FEL

UINTAH Engineering

UNDESIGNATED ( 2 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface
LEASE NUMBER: UTU-77301

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal
LATITUDE: 40.08204

PROPOSED FORMATION: MVRD

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.2512

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

'Plat R649-2-3.

Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit BIG VALLEY

CRo.ESBOOOO24 )
Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920'Between Wells

Water Permit yr R649-3-3. Exception
ORo.43-8496 )

Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No:(Date:
Eff Date:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: 9 le )

STIPULATIONS: c
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19 FEDERAL

TES R23E TSS R24E

SAND RIDGE FIELD
INACTIVE = 2,

BlG VALLEY UNIT

T9S R23E T9S R24E

NATURAL BUTTES
FIELD

OPERATOR: QEP UINTA BASIN INC (N2660)

SEC: 31 T. SS R. 24E

FIELD:UNDESIGNATED (002)

COUNTY: UINTAH

SPACING:R64>3-3/EXCEFFIONLOCATION ells
N Utah ORGas and Maag

X LOCATION ABANDONED
O NEW LOCATION

Field Status Unit Status PLUGGED &cABANDONED
ABANDONED EXPLORATORY PRODUCINGGAS
ACTIVE GASSTORACE e PRODUCINGOILNF PP OIL 4 SHUT-IN GASCOMBINED NF SECONDARY

. SHUT-IN OILINACTIVE NDING
)s( TEMP. ABANDONEDPROPOSED

PP GAS o TEST WELLSTORAGE
PP GEØrHERML & WATER INJECTION STERMINATED PP OIL g WATER SUPPLY PREPARED BY: DIANA WHTTNEY
SECONDARY g' WATER DISPOSAL DATE 11-OCTOBER-2005
TERMINATED T



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office
P.O.Box45155

Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

INREPLYREFERTO:
3160
(UT-922)

Dctober 11,2005

A4enioranduni

To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2005 Plan of Development Big Valley Unit, Uintah County,
Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining, and Mickey
Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land Management, the following wells are
planned for calendar year 2005 within the BigValley, Uintah County, Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

43-047-37240 NBZ 11ML-29-8-24 Sec 29 TOSS R24E 1949 FSL 2278 FWL
43-047-37237 NBZ 13ML-29-8-24 Sec 29 TOBS R24E 0601 FSL 0572 FWL
43-047-37241 NBZ 05ML-29-8-24 Sec 29 TOBS R24E 1979 ENL 0661 FWL
43-047-37243 NBZ 07ML-29-8-24 Sec 29 TOBS R24E 1926 ENL 2025 FEL
43-047-37244 NBZ 09ML-29-8-24 Sec 29 TOBS R24E 1789 FSL 0860 FEL
43-047-37246 NBZ 15ML-29-8-24 Sec 29 TOBS R24E 0627 FSL 1784 FEL
43-047-37229 NBZ 04ML-30-8-24 Sec 30 TOBS R24E 0859 FNL 0674 FWL
43-047-37230 NBZ 06ML-30-8-24 Sec 30 TOBS R24E 1996 ENL 2142 FWL
43-047-37231 NBZ 08ML-30-8-24 Sec 30 TOSS R24E 2009 FNL 0714 FEL
43-047-37232 NBZ 10ML-30-8-24 Sec 30 TOBS R24E 2158 FSL 2056 FEL
43-047-37233 NBZ 12ML-30-8-24 Sec 30 TOBS R24E 1980 FSL 0621 FWL
43-047-37234 NBZ 14ML-30-8-24 Sec 30 TOBS R24E 0547 FSL 1938 FWL
43-047-37235 NBZ 06ML-31-8-24 Sec 31 TOBS R24E 2021 ENL 1891 FWL
43-047-37236 NBZ 04ML-31-8-24 Sec 31 TOBS R24E 0859 FNL 0810 FWL
43-047-37239 NBZ 02ML-31-8-24 Sec 31 TOBS R24E 0344 FNL 2015 FEL
43-047-37238 NBZ 08ML-31-8-24 Sec 31 TOBS R24E 1581 FNL 1233 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at thistime.

Is/ Michael L.



JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah October 24, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

QEP Uinta Basin INCMICHAEL R. STYLER *

Execudve Director 11002 East 17500 South

Division &
Vemal, UT 84078

Oil, Gas & Mining

MARY ANN WRIGHT Re: NBZ 8ML-31-8-24 Well, 1581' FNL, 1233' FEL, SE NE, Sec. 31, T. 8 South,
Acting Division Director R. 24 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative
approval of the requested exception location is hereby granted.

Administrative approvalfor commingling the production from the Wasatch
formation and the Mesaverde formation in thiswell is hereby granted. Appropriate
information has been submitted to DOGM in accordance with R649-3-22. No written
objections from owners were received by DOGM.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to thiswell is 43-047-37238.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

mf
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management,Vernal DistrictOffice

1594WestNorthTemple,Suite 1210,PO Box 145801,SaltLakeCity,UT 84114-5801
telephone(801) 538-5340•facsimile (801)359-3940 • TIY (801) 538-7458



O O

Operator: OEP Uinta Basin, INC
Well Name & Number NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

API Number: 43-047-37238
Lease: UTU-77301

Location: SE NE Sec._3_1_ T. 8 South R. 24 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application forpermit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the



e RECEIVE¶) FORM APPROVED

" UNITED STATES siTuðaßlL
ExpreMsFNe

a , 995

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-77301

y i di 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN NIA

TYPE OF WORK 7. UNITAGREEMENT NAME
DRILL DEEPENO BIG VALLEY UNIT # UTU-81308X

TYPE OF WELL 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.

O O SINGLE MULTIPLE
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Contact: Jan Nelson 9.AP MB R:
QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. E-Mail: jan.nelson@questar.com

3. ADDRESS Telphone number 10. FIELD AND $OOL, OR WILDCAT
11002 E. 17500 S. Vernal, Ut 84078 Phone 435-781-4331 Fax 435-781-4323 UNDESIGNATED

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*) 11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEY OR AREA
At'Surface 1581' FNL 1233' FEL SENE, SECTION 31, TSS, R24E
At proposed production zone SEC.31 T8S R24E Mer SLB

14. DISTANCE IN MILES FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POSTOFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARIS 13. STATE
34 + / - SOUTHEAST OF VERNAL, UTAH Uintah UT
15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION TO NEAREST 16.NO.OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(also to nearest drig,unit line if any) 1505.46 40

1233' +l-

18.DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BLMIBIA Bond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, R 9000, ESBOOOO24

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.) 22. DATE WORK WILL START 23. Estimated duration
5081.2' GR ASAP 10 days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:
1. Wellplat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond tocover the operations unless covered by an exisitingbond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan Item 20 above).
3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is on National Forest System Lands' 5. Operator certification.

theSUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office) 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.

SIGNED Name (printedItyped) Jan Nelson DATE October 3, 2005

TITLE egulatory Affairs

(This space for Federal or State office use)

PERMITNO. APPROVAL Opp0 FEBa8 2008
Application approval does not warrant or certify the appilcant holds an al or equitable titleto those rights in the subJect e ich would entitle the appilcant to conduct operations thereon

CONDITIONSOF AL, IF AN .

Msistant FlekiMaragg
APPROVED ITLE DAT

*See Instructions On Reverse Side

Title 18 U.S.C ction 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfullyto make to any de¡iartment or agency of the

UnitedStatesanyfat i r ra t r sen lo s n t i it di



O O
UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
VERNAL FIELD OFFICE

170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Location: SENE, Sec 31, TSS, R24E
Well No: NBZ 8ML-31-8-24 Lease No: UTU-77301
API No: 43-047-37238 Agreement: Big Valley Unit

Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker Office: 435-781-4490 Cell: 435-828-4470
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee Office:435-781-4432 Cell:435-828-7875
Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger Office: 435-781-4502 Cell: 435-828-3913
Environmental Scientist: Paul Buhler Office: 435-781-4475 Cell: 435-828-4029
Environmental Scientist: Karl Wright Office: 435-781-4484
Natural Resource Specialist: Holly Villa Office: 435-781-4404
Natural Resource Specialist: Melissa Hawk Office: 435-781-4476
After hours contact number: (435) 781-4513 FAX: (435) 781-4410

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONSSHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with the applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application
for Permit to Drill including Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is
considered fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD
must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion operations.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and
(Notify Paul Buhler) access roads.

Location Completion Prior to movingon the drilling rig.
(Notify Paul Buhler)

Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notify PE)

Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and
(Notify Jamie Sparger) cementing all casing strings.

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
(Notify Jamie Sparger)

First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify PE) production resumes after well has been off production for

more than ninety (90)



Page 2 of 7
Well: NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

1/27/2006

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

• Within 90 calendar days of the approval date for thisApplication for Permit to Drill
(APD), the operator/lessee shall submit to the Authorized Officer (AO), on Sundry Notice
Form 3160-5, an Interim Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on well pads,
access roads, and pipelines. At a minimum, thiswill include the reshaping of the pad to
the original contour to the extent possible; the respreading of the top soil up to the rig
anchor points; and, the area reseeded using appropriate reclamation methods. The AO
will provide written approval or concurrence within30 calendar days of reœipt.

• A Paleontologist acceptable to the BLMwillmonitor construction activityfor surface
disturbing activities described in theAPD. If paleontologic resources are uncovered
during construction activities, the operator shall immediately suspend all operations that
willfurther disturb such resources, and immediately notifythe Authorized Officer(AO).
The AO willarrange for a determination of significance and, if necessary, recommend a
recovery or avoidance plan.

• If paleontologic materials are uncovered during construction,the operator shall
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials and contact the
Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will be made by the AO as to what mitigation
willbe necessary for the discovered paleontologic material.

• Following well plugging and abandonment, the location, access roads, pipelines, and
other facilities shall be reclaimed. All disturbed surfaces shall be reshaped to
approximate the original contour; the top soil respread over the surface; and, the surface
revegetated. The surface of approved staging areas where construction activities did
not occur may require disking or rippingand reseeding.

• The pipeline shall be buried withinthe identified construction width of an access corridor
that contains the access road and pipelines. The operator may request in writing an
exception to this COA. Exceptions to this COA may include but are not limited to:
laterally extensive, hard indurated bedrock, such as sandstone, which is at or within2
feet of the surface; and, soil types with a poor history for successful rehabilitation. The
exception request willbe reviewed by the authorized officer (AO) and a determination
made.

• The buried pipeline exception request has been received. It has been determined that
the pipeline route has bedrock exposed at the surface. The exception is granted for a
surface pipeline.

• Prior to abandonment of a buried pipeline, the operator willobtain authorization from the
appropriate regulatory agency. BLMwilldetermine whether the pipeline and all above
ground pipeline facilities shall be removed and unsalvageable materials disposed of at
approved sites or abandoned in place. Reshaping and revegetation of disturbed land
areas will be completed where
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Well: NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

1/18/2006

The followingseed mixture shall be used:

Type Ibs.lacre
Shadscale Atriplex confertifolia 3
Fourwing salt bush Atgriplex canescens 3
Galleta grass Hilaria jamesii 3
Gardners salt brush Atriplex gardneri 3
** Seed shall be drilled; but if broadcasted double the pounds per
acre used and work the solids mechanically to cover the seed.

• Other reclamation methods including but not limited to mulching or soil treatments may
be required on a site-specific
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Well: NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

1/18/2006

DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

All provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
• Production casing cement shall be at a minimum of 3000' or shallower.
• A Cement Bond Log shall be run from the production casing shoe to the surface casing

shoe.

• DRILLINGICOMPLETIONIPRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS
• There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover

program as approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. AIIwells,
whether drilling,producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well. Any changes in
operation must have prior approval from the BLM,Vernal Field Office Petroleum
Engineers.

• The spud date and timeshall be reported orallyto Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding.

• Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least
24 hours in advance of casinq cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure
tests.

• Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) will remain in use untilthe well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls must remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all
times. Choke manifolds must be located outside of the rig substructure.

• AIIBOPE components willbe inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in
the daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by
Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE
pressure tests must be performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and _N_O_Tby the
rig pumps. Test must be reported in the driller's log.

• BOP drills must be initiallyconducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out
from under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas
Order No. 2.

• Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set
and cemented in place.

• No aggressivelfresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

• All shows of fresh water and minerals willbe reported and protected. A sample will be
taken of any water flows and a water analysis furnished the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All
oil and gas shows will be adequately tested for commercial possibilities, reported, and
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Well: NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

1/18/2006

• No location will be coristructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or
workover equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status
without prior approval of the BLM,Vernal Field Office. Ifoperations are to be suspended
for more than 30 days, prior approval of the BLM,Vernal Field Office must be obtained
and notification given before resumption of operations.

• Chronologic drilling progress reports must be filed directly with the BLM, Vernal Field
Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers
until the well is completed.

• Any change in the program must be approved by the BLM, Vernal Field Office. "Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells" (Form BLM3160-5) must be filed for all changes of plans
and other operations in accordance with43 CFR 3162.3-2.

• Emergency approval may be obtained orally,but such approval does not waive the
written report requirement. Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of
facilities, including roads, gathering lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the
disturbance of new ground, willrequire the filing of a suitable plan pursuant to Onshore
Oil & Gas Order No. 1 of 43 CFR 3164.1 and prior approval by the BLM, Vernal Field
Office.

• In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, thiswell must be reported on the "Monthly Report
of Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in
which operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically
plugged and abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals
Management Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-
525-7922 (303) 231-3650 for reporting information.

• Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) willbe submitted not later than 30
days after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all
other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or
completion operations, will be filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well
completion report a geologic report including, at a minimum,formation tops, and a
summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys, sample descriptions, strip
logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if performed.
Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) will be submitted only when requested by the BLM,
Vernal Field Office.

• Please submit an electronic copy of all logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_We111ogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM. The cement bond log must be submitted in
raster format (TIF, PDF other).

• All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or comminglingon-lease or off-lease will
have prior written approval from the BLM,Vernal Field Office.

• All measurement points shall be identified as point of sales or allocation for royalty
determination prior to the installation of
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1/18/2006

• Oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The Field Office
Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and timefor the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be
submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities willconform to the
API standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas
measurement.

• A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Office within30 days of installation or first production,
whichever occurs first. AIIsite security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas
Order No. 3 shall be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon
storage tanks will be effectivelysealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No.
3.

• This APD is approved subject to the requirement that, should the well be successfully
completed for production, the BLM, Vernal Field office must be notified when it is placed
in a producing status. Such notification will be by written communication and must be
received in this office by not later than the fifth business day following the date on which
the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a minimum, the
following informational items:

• Operator name, address, and telephone number.

• Well name and number.

• Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

• Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for which
royalty will be paid).

• The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing head
gas, or natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

• The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is located;
otherwise the non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State or private.

• Unit agreement and / or participating area name and number, if applicable.

• Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

• Any venting or flaring of gas will be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A
and needs prior approval from Field Office Petroleum Engineers.

• All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL
3A will be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events as defined in NTL3A,
will be reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days.
"Other than Major Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will
be reported on the Monthly Report of Operations and
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1/18/2006

• Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced frotn thiswellfor a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A
permanent disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the
end of this 90-day period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed
permanent disposal method shall be submitted along with any necessary water
analyses, as soon as possible, but no later than 45 days after the date of first production.
Any method of disposal which has not been approved prior to the end of the authorized
90-day period will be considered as an Incident of Noncompliance and will be grounds
for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for disposing of said water is
provided and approved by this office.

• Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field
Office Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging
of the well, in order that a representative may witness plugging operations. Ifa well is
suspended or abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled.
The "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within
30 days after the actual plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of
cement in each, and amount of casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
UTU-77301

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnewwells,significantly deepen existingwells below current bo I , or t° BIG VALLEYUNIT# UTU-81308X

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP UINTABASIN, INC 4304737238
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

11002 E. 17500 S· CITY VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4331 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1581' FNL 1233' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENE 31 8S 24E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: APD EXTENSION

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. hereby requests a 1 year extension on the NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

Approvedby the
Utah Divisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining

Date:

By:

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Nelson TITLE Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE DATE 10/18/2006

(This space for State only)

RECE VED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIVOFOlL,GAS&



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform shouldaccompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-37238
Well Name: NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

Location: 1581' FNL 1233' FEL, SENE, SEC.31 TSS R24E.
Company Permit Issued to: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
Date Original Permit Issued: 10/24/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application,which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes O No O

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO No2

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesO No2

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way,which could affect the proposed location? YesO No O

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged? YesO NoO

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesO No2

Is bondi still in place, which covers thisproposed well? YesŒNoO

10/18/2006

Sig tur/e Date

Title: REGULATORY AFFAIRS

Representing: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. RcC VED
OCT2 4 2006

DIVOFOlL,GAS&



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-QuestarE&P Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900

CA No. Unit: BIG VALLEY UNIT

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

SEE ATTACHED LISTS *

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/31/2005
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143

5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 4/23/2007 BIA

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 4/23/2007

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.
SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xls 4/30/2007 AND



1 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
BIGVALLEYUN1T

Original Wel1Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWS 3ML-9-9-24 RWS 3ML-9-9-24 NENW 09 090S 240E 4304735483 15190 Federal GW S
RWS 10ML-6-9-24 RWS 10ML-6-9-24 NWSE 06 090S 240E Š0473565315333 Federal GW P
CWD 4ML-32-8-24 CWD 4ML-32-8-24 NWNW 32 080S 240E 4304735684 14288 Federal GW P
NBZ 4ML-30-8-24 NBZ 4D-30-8-24 NWNW 30 080S 240E 4304737229 Federal GW APD
NBZ 6ML-30-8-24 NBZ 6M -30-8-24 SENW 30 080S 240E 4304737230 Federal GW APD
NBZ 8ML-30-8-24 NBZ 8ML-30-8-24 SENE 30 080S 240E 4304737231 15976 Federal GW DRL
NBZ 10ML-30-8-24 NBZ 10ML-30-8-24 NWSE 30 080S 240E 4304737232 Federal GW APD
NBZ 12ML-30-8-24 NBZ 12D-30-8-24 NWSW 30 080S 240E 4304737233 Federal GW APD
NBZ 14ML-30-8-24 NBZ 14ML-30-8-24 SESW 30 080S 240E 4304737234 | Federal GW APD
NBZ 6ML-31-8-24 iNBZ 6D-31-8-24 SENW 31 080S 240E 4304737235 Federal GW APD
NBZ 4ML-31-8-24 NBZ 4D-31-8-24 NWNW 31 080S I 240E 4304737236 Federal GW APD
NBZ 13ML-29-8-24 NBZ 13ML-29-8-24 SWSW 29 080S I 240E 4304737237 15954 Faleral GW IDRL
NBZ 8ML-31-8-24 NBZ 8D-31-8-24 SENE 31 080S 240E 4304737238 Federal GW 'APD
NBZ2ML-31-8-24 _ _ NBZ2ML-31-8-24 NWNE 31 080S 240E 4304737239 Federal GW APD
NBZ 11ML-29-8-24 NBZ 11D-29-8-24_ NESW 29 | 080S 240E 4304737240 Federal GW APD
NBZ SML-29-8-24 NBZ 5D-29-8-24 SWNW 29 080S 240E 4304737241 Federal GW APD
NBZ7ML-29-8-24 NBZ7ML-29-8-24 SWNE 29 i 080S 240E 4304737243 Federal GW APD
NBZ9ML-29-8-24 NBZ9D-29-8-24 NESE 29 080S 240E 4304737244 Federal GW APD
NBZ 15ML-29-8-24 NBZ 15ML-29-8-24 SWSE 29 0808 240E 4304737246 Federal GW APD
CWD 3ML-32-8-24 CWD 3ML-32-8-24 NENW 32 i 0808 240E 4304737274 Federal GW APD
CWD 8ML-32-8-24 CWD 8ML-32-8-24 SENE 32 I 080S 240E 4304737275 Federal GW APD
CWÏ)12ML-32-8-24 CWD 12ML-32-8-24 NWSW 32 080S 240E 4304737276 15323 Federal GW S
CWD 14ML-32-8-24 CWD 14ML-32-8-24 SESW 32 080S 240E 4304737277 Federal GW APD
CWD 16ML-32-8-24 CWD 16D-32-8-24 SESE 32 080S 240E 4304737278 Federal GW APD
RWS 2ML-5-9-24 RWS 2ML-5-9-24 INWNE 05 090S 240E 4304737306 15925 Federal GW , DRL
RWS 8ML-5-9-24 RWS 8D-5-9-24 SENE 05 090S 240E 4304737307 Federal GW APD
RWS 10ML-5-9-24 RWS 10ML-5-9-24 NWSE 05 090S 240E 4304737308 15787 Federal GW P
RWS 12ML-5-9-24 RWS 12ML-5-9-24 NWSW 05 090S 240E 4304737309 15481 Federal GW P
RWS 14ML-5-9-24 RWS 14D-5-9-24 SESW 05 090S 240E 4304737310 Federal GW APD
RWS 16ML-5-9-24 RWS 16ML-5-9-24 SESE 05 090S 240E 4304737311

¯
Federal GW APD

RWS 12ML-6-9-24 RWS 12ML-6-9-24 NWSW 06 090S 240E I 4304737312 15947 Federal GW DRL
RWS 16ML-6-9-24 RWS 16ML-6-9-24 SESE 06 090S 240E 4304737335 15788 Federal GW DRL
CWD IML-32-8-24 CWD 1ML-32-8-24 NENE 32 080S 240E 4304737346 Federal GW APD
CWD 10ML-32-8-24 CWD 10D-32-8-24 NWSE i 32 080S 240E | 4304737347 Federal GW APD
RWS 6D-5-9-24 RWS 6D-5-9-24 SENW 05 090S 240E 4304737350 Federal GW APD
RWS 4ML-5-9-24 RWS 4ML-5-9-24 NWNW 05 090S 240E 4304737351 16020 Federal GW DRL
RWS 8D-6-9-24 RWS 8D-6-9-24 SENE 06 0908 240E 4304737352 15858 Federal GW DRL
RWS 2ML-6-9-24 RWS 2D-6-9-24 NWNE 06 0908 240E 4304737411 Federal IGW :APD
RWS 4ML-6-9-24 RWS 4ML-6-9-24 NWNW 06 0908 240E 4304737412 16035 Federal GW DRL
RWS 6D-6-9-24 RWS 6D-6-9-24 SENW 06 090S 240E 4304737413 99999 Federal GW |DRL
RWS 14ML-6-9-24 RWS 14D-6-9-24 SESW 06 090S 240E 4304737414 , Federal GW



2 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
BIG VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWS 5ML-9-9-24 S 5ML-9-9-24 SWNW 09 | 0908 I 240E 4304738645 Federal GW APD
RWS 12ML-9-9-24 RWS 12ML-9-9-24 NWSW 09 I 0908 240E 4304738646 Federal GW



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS ANDMINING 6. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS see attached
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnew Wells, significantly deepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals. See attached
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER.

QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL. ORWILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 av r Denver

sTA re CO , 80265 (303) 308-3068
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

9t CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDI2E DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Operator Name
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE- DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow allpertinentdetails Including dates, depths, volurnes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., willhereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. This name change involves onlyan internal corporate name change and no thirdparty
change of operator is involved. The same employeeswillcontinueto be responsible for operationsof the propertles described
on the attached list. AIIoperationswillcontinueto be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965003033
Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operator of record, QEP UINTABASIN,INC , hereby r signs as operatorof the properties as described on the
attached list.

Ja es , Executive Vice President, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIO 'ND PO UCTIONCOMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligationsas operator of the properties as descr ed on the ttachedlist

Jayf. Neese, Exec tiveVice President
QGestar Exploration and Production Company

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) ÄK. Stanberry ; ) TITLE Supervisor,Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE DATE 3/16/2007

(This space for Stato use only)

RECENED

APR1 3 2007
(5/2000) (See instructions on ReverseSide)

DN.0FOL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOFNATURALRESOURGES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ONWELLS IFINDIAN ALht0TTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CAAGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth. reenter plugged wells, or to
See attacheddrill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER 8 WELLNAMcEhanddNUMBER:

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR; 9 APINUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, ORWILDCAT
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver s CO , 80265 (303) 308-3068

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACEattached coUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING O PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate ofworkcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Name Changes
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly showallpertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PER THE ATTACHED LIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTS THATTHE
INDIVIDUALWELL NAMES BE UPDATED INYOUR RECORDS.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) () , TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affalrs

SIGNATURE --- DATE 4/17/2007

(This space for Stato use only)

RECEIVED
APR13 2007(See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV,OFOlL,GAS&MIMNG



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Ros Utah State Office TAKE PRioE'
P.O. Box 45155 '"AM ERicA

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

April23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Big Valley Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as Unit Operator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor UnitOperator for the Big Valley Unit,UintahCounty, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unitagreement. The instrument is hereby approved effectiveApril23, 2007.
In approvingthis designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the

designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle itto conduct operations under
the Big Valley UnitAgreement.

Yournationwideoiland gas bond No. ESBOOOO24willbe used to cover allfederal operations within
the Big ValleyUnit.

It is requested that you notifyall interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federaloffices,with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
boo: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil,Gas & Mining
File - Big ValleyUnit (wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron
Reading File p GENED
Central Files

UT922:TAThompson:tt:4/23/07 AŸR

DIVOFOg GAR&



Form 316 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(November 1994) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOly xp n ul

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT MLL5.Lease SerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON vyg UTU-77301
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or : | 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
DEPT.0F THENTERI N/A

. ..

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - OfflerInstructions on reverse side BIG VALLEYUNIT#UTU-81308X

1. Type of Well

Oil Well O Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Contact: Jan NelsOn 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-37238

11002 East 17500 South, Vernal, UT 84078 435-781-403Ž 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED
1581' FNL 1233' FEL SENE SECTION 31, T8S, R24E 11. Countyor Parish, State

Uintah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

O Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon APD EXTENSION

O Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all patinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration therco£

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplele horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of aB pertinent markers and zonca

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days

Following complelion of the involved operations If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a F<rm 3160-4 shan be filed once

Testing has bem completed. Final Abandonment Notices shaR be filed only af1er all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has

determined thatthe site is ready for final inspection.)

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., hereby requests a 1 year extension on the APD for the NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

BLMAPD approval date: 1-27-2006.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Laura Bills Regulatory Assistant
signatu Da

uary 23, 2007
THISSPACEFOR FEOGRALORSTATEUSE

Approved by Title Date

Petroleum Engineer FEB 6 .

Conditionsof any, are Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify Office
that the applicanthol egal or equitable title to those rights in the subjectlease which would

entitlethe applicantto conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United States any false, fictitious or RECENËD
fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-37238

Well Name: NBZ 8ML-31-8-24

Location: 1581' FNL 1233' FEL, SENE, SEC.31, TSS, R24E

Company Permit Issued to: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.

Date Original Permit Issued: 1/27/2006

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Followinq is a checklistof some items related to the application,which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownershipchanged, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONoO

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed wellwhich would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO Nom

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of thisproposed well? YesO No O

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way,which could affect the proposed location? YesO No O

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged? YesO NoO

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesO NoO

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? YesŒNoO

1/23/2007

'Skin'ature Date

Title: REGULATORY ASSISTANT

Representing: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.

RECENED

MAR052007

08 OFOLGAS



CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

QEP Uintah Basin, Inc.

Notice of Intent
APD Extension

Lease: UTU-77301
Well: NBZ 8ML-31-8-24
Location: SENE Sec 31-T8S-R24E

An extension for the referenced APD is granted with the following conditions:

1. The extension and APD shall expire on 2M/0K

2. No other extension shall be granted.

If you have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Matt Baker of this office at
(435) 781-4490

RECENED
MAR052007

DN.0F0\L,GAS&



CONFlOElilAl.
Form316 5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED

(November 199‡) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Ö.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-77301
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
N/A
7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side BIG VALLEYUNIT UTU-81308X
1 Type of Well

Oil Well O Gas Well
[¯¯]

Other 8. Well Name and No.
2 Name ofOperator NBZ 8ML-31-8-24
Questar Exploration & Production Co Contact Jan Nelson 9. API Well No.
3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-37238

1571 East 1700 South Vemal. Utah 84078 |435-781-4032 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage. Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) UNDES IGNATED
1581' FNL 1233' FEL. SENE. SECTION 31. T8S R24E I l. Countyor Parish, State

UINTAH

12. CIIECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTIIER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

O Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete X Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon Name Change
O Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

I l Ikserihe Pmposed or Completed Operanons (elearly Wale all pertinent details, including estimuted sturting date of any proposed work und approxstnate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directiomdiv or reconylete horisontally, give subsurfnee locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and ¿ames

Aitach the iland unds:r which the work will be perfrwmed or provide the ihmd Na on lile with lifAtilllA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
lollowing completion of the involted operations If the operation resuhs in a multiple compktäm or recompkoon in a new interial. a Ftzm 3160-4 shall be illax! once

lesting hus been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements including reclarmtam, have been completed and the operutor has
determined that the site is ready thr final inspection.)

Questar E & P proposes to deepen the well from the approved total depth of 9,000' to 13,325'. The proposed changes require a
change in casing design and cement design Attached is a new 8-point Drilling Plan showing the proposed changes.

Questar E & P also proposes to change the well name from NBZ BML-31-8-24 to NBZ 8D-31-8-24.

Approvedby the
Utah DMslonof

05, Gas and Mining

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed Taped) Title

Jan Nelson Requiatory Affairs
Signature Date

July 30, 2007
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

l'onditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warant or certify OtTice
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would

entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 I S.C. Section 1001. makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfillly to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or

fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on



ONSHORE OIL & GAS OK ER INO.1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION
NBZ 80-31-8-24

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth
Uinta Surface
Green River 1,604'
Wasatch 4,317'
Mesaverde 5,867'
Sego 7,979'
Castlegate 8,144'
Mancos 8,615'
Dakota 12,769'
TD 13,325'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas. Or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 4,317'
Gas Mesaverde 5,867'
Gas Mancos 8,615'
Gas Dakota 12,769'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah formOGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected, samples will
be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be
obtained from Wonsits Valley water right # A36125 (which was filed on May 7, 1964,) or
Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined
by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before1989 is not
depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to supply fresh water for drilling
purposes. All water resulting from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red



ONSHORE OIL & GAS Ok ER 190. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION
NBZ 8D-3 l-8-24

DRILLING PROGRAM

Central Battery Disposal Site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal
Site; SWNW, Section 12, T8S, R21E.

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 5,000 psi double gate and 5,000 psi annular BOP (schematic attached) to 8,750' or
intermediate casing point. 10,000 psi double gate, 10,000 psi single gate, and
10,000 psi annular BOP (schematic attached) below intermediate casing point.

B. Functional test daily

C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.22psi/foot or 1500 psi, whichever is
greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed
the internal yield pressure of the casing.

D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 5M and 10M system and individual
components shall be operable as designed.

4. Casing Design:

Hole Csg. Top Bottom Wt. Grade Thread Cond.
Size Size (MD) (MD)

17-1/2"" 14" sfc 40' Steel Cond. None Used

12-1/4" 9-5/8" sfc 2,200' 36.0 J-55 STC New

8-3/4" 7" sfc 8,750' 26.0 HCP-110 LTC New

6-1/8" 4-1/2" sfc 12,800' 13.5 P-110 LTC New

6-1/8" 4-1/2" sfc 13,325' 15.1 P-110 LTC New

Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile
(minimum)

9-5/8" 36.0 lb. J-55 STC 2,020 psi 3,520 psi 394,000 lb.

7" 26.0 lb. HCP-110 LTC 7,800 psi 9,950 psi 693,000 lb.

4-1/2" 13.5 lb. P-110 LTC 10,680 psi 12,410 psi 338,000 lb.

4-1/2" 15.1 lb. P-110 LTC 14,350 psi 14,420 psi 406,000



ONSHORE OIL & GAS Ok ER NO. l
QUESTAR EXPI ORATION & PRODUCTION
NBZ 8D-3 I -8-24

DRILLING PROGRAM

MINIMUM DESIGN FACTORS:

COLLAPSE: 1.125
BURST: 1.10
TENSION: 1.80

Area Fracture Gradient: 0.9 psi/foot
Maximum anticipated mud weight: 13.7 ppg
Maximum surface treating pressure: 8,800 psi

5. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - no

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually and/or PVT/Flow Show

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Rotating Head yes
lf drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling
below 500').

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will
be used. It is not intended to use oil in the mud, however, in the event it is used, oil
concentration will be less than 4% by volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 13.7
ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to



ONSHORE OIL & GAS OkoßR NO. l
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION
NBZ 8D-31-8-24

DRILLING PROGRAM

6. Testina, loggine and corine program

A. Cores - none anticipated

B. DST - none anticipated

C. Logging - Mud logging - 3000' to TD
GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density

D. Formation and Completion Interval: Dakota, Mancos, Mesaverde, Wasatch
intervals, final determination of completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation - Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

7. Cementing Program

20" Conductor:
Cement to surface with construction cement.

9-5/8" Surface Casing: sfc - 2,200' (MD)
Lead/Tail Slurry: 0' - 2,200'. 760 sks (1375 cu ft) Rockies LT cement + 0.25 lb/sk
Kwik Seal + 0.125 lb/sk Poly-E-Flake. Slurry wt: 13.5 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.8l ft'/sk,
Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 100% excess.

7" Intermediate Casing: sfc - 8,750' (MD)
Lead Slurry: 0' - 4,000'. 185 sks (710 cu ft) Halliburton Hi-Fill cement + 0.125 lb/sk
Poly-E-Flake. Slurry wt: 11.0 ppg, Slurry yield: 3.84 ft3/sk, Slurry volume: 8-3/ 4" hole +

25% excess in open hole section.
Tail Slurry: 4,000' - 8,750'. 720 sks (895 cu ft) 50/50 Poz Premium + 0.6% Halad (R)-
322 fluid loss + 2.0% Microbond M expander + 5% salt + 0.125 lb/sk Poly-E-Flake.
Slurry wt: 14.35 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.24 ft*/sk, Slurry volume: 8-3/4" hole + 25% excess.

4-1/2" Production Casing: sfc - 13,325' (MD)
Lead/Tail Slurry: 4,000' - 13,325'. 855 sks (1325 cu ft) 50/50 Poz Premium cement +

20% SSA-1 + 3 lb/sk Silicalite Compacted + 0.5% Halad(R)-344 + 0.2% Halad(R)-413 +

0.2% HR-12 ÷ 0.2% Super CBI + 0.2% Suspend HT. Slurry wt: 14.0 ppg, Slurry yield:
1.55 ft3/sk, Slurry volume: 6-1/8" hole + 20% excess in open hole section.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface on the intermediate string and 4,000' on the production
string. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and across zones as reqüired by
the authorized officer to insure protection of natural



ONSHORE OIL & GAS OK ER 190. l
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION
NBZ 8D-31-8-24

DRILLING PROGRAM

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 9,500 psi. Maximum
anticipated bottom hole temperatureis 255°
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State of Utah OPERATOR ACCT. No. N-5085
Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: Questar Exploration & Production Co.

ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South
ENTITYACTIONFORM - FORM6 Vernal, Utah 84078-8526 (435)781-4342

Action Current New Entity API Number Well Name QQ SC TP RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No.

No.
99999 43-047-37238 NBZ 8D 31 8 24 SENE 31 8S 24E UIntah 8/27/07

WELL 1 COMMENTS:

CONFllENTIAL
| | lill

WELL 2 COMMENTS:

I | | | \ \
WELL3 COMMENTS:

| | | | || I
WELL4 COMMENTS:

lil llIIII
WELL 5 COMMENTS:

ACTIONCODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entityfor new well (singlewellonly)
B - Add new well to existingentity(groupor unitwell)
C - Re-assign well from one existingentitytoanotherexistingentity SignaTure
D - Re-assign well from one existingentitytoa new entity
E - Other (explain in commentssection) Office Administrator II 8/27/07

Title Date
NOTE: Use COMMEN Ysection to explain whyeach ActionCode was selected

Phone No. (435)781g2
(3/89) RECEIVED

AUS3 1 2007 00NRDENTIAL
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Foun 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

onneimo)
- DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BudgetBureauNo.10044)135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March31,1W3

5 Inse Designation and SerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-77301

Do not use this formfor proposals to drill or to deepenor reentry to a differentreservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposalS

5 If Indian, Allottee orTribe Name

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE' -
' """"°r CA, AgreementDesignation

U " O --
.

CONFilENTIAL3 We11Namean N

NBZ 8D 31 8 24
2 NameofOperator A

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 9 APIWel1No.

3 AddressandTelephoneNo Contact: Dahn.Caldwell@questar.com 43-047-37238

11002 E. 17500 S. - Vernal, UT 84078 435-781-4342 Fax 435-781-4357 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of We11(Footage,Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED

1581' FNL, 1233' FEL, SENE, SEC 31-T8S-R24E ll CountyorParish,State

UINTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE B )X(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, )R OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NoliceofIntent Abandonment Ch fa

O --- O New Constmetion

Subsequent Report Non outine Fracmring

O -- O *-""

O Final Abandonment Na Ahmg C Comio on

Other SPUD

(Note) Report results of multiple compleiion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of startingany proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measuredand true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

On 8/27/07 - Drilled 17-1/2" conductor hole to 40'. Set 40' of 14" conductor pipe. Cmtd w/ Ready Mix.

RECElVED
3 - BLM, 2- Utah OG&M, 1 - Denver, 1 - file Word file-server

AUS3 1 2007

DN.0FOlL,GAS&MINING
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is /

Signed Dahn F. Caldwell
. ( Office Administator II a.' 8/27/2007

(This space for Federal or State offim use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of appmval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C.Section1001,makes it a crimefor any person knowinglyand willfully to maketo any departmentor agencyofthe UnitedStatesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor
representations as to any matterwithin its



Questar E &P Page 1 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

8/30/2007 06:00 - 00:00 18.00 LOC 3 MIRU
00:00 - 05:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILLED 0 / 1190'
05:00 - 06:00 1.00 TRP 10 BIT TRIP

8/31/2007 06:00 - 20:30 14.50 DRL 1 DRILL 1190' / 1820' - WATER FLOW @1630'
20:30 - 01:30 5.00 TRP 10 BIT TRIP
01:30 - 06:00 4.50 DRILL 1820' / 1990'

9/1/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL 1990' / 2260'
13:00 - 14:00 1.00 TRP 3 L.D.D.P.
14:00 - 16:30 2.50 CSG 2 RAN 2210' 9 5/8" 36# CASING
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 CMT 2 CEMENT CASING 760 SKS. CLASS G
17:00 -06:00 13.00 LOC 8 R/D & RELEASE RIG

9/11/2007 06:00 -19:00 13.00 LOC 3 MOVE IN RIG 90% MOVED IN - SET MAT BOARDS / SUB BASE I INSTAL
SPREADER BEAMS ON SUB

NOTIFIED CLIFF JOHNSON BLM OF MOVING ON LOCATION
19:00 -06:00 11.00 LOC 4 RIG IDLE WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

9/12/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIU RIG35% - REPAIR DWKSBRAKES&DRUM - BREAK DOWN DERRICK
FOR INSPECTION - TRUCKSRELEASED @1700 HR.

18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG IDLE WAITING ON DAYLIGHT
9/13/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG UP 45%- SAND BLAST PIN POCKETSON DERRICK,A-LEGS,DERRICK

SHOES, DEAD-MAN ACHOR,CROWN AND CRAZE WHEEL. MAGNA FLUX
SAME.- CHANGED OUT BREAK FLANGES ON DWKS. CHANGED RADIATOR
ON #2 PUMP MOTOR AND WORK ON ACHORS FOR NEW FLARE LINES

18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG IDLE WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
9/14/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIGUP - PUT DWKSBACK TOGETHER,PRIMER AND PAINT SPOT ON

DERRICK THAT WAS CHECKED, HELP WELDERS BUILD FLARE LINE ACHORS
AND PUT FLARE LINE TOGETHER.

9/15/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG UP - 70% - PUT DERRICK BACK TOGETHER AFTER INSPECTIONAND
FINISH SETTING RIG IN - FLARE BOX AND BAR HOPPERS

18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG IDLE - WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
9/16/2007 06:00 -06:00 24.00 LOC 4 RIGUP -100%- STRING UP BLOCKS, PREPARE DERRICK TO RAISE,BURN IN

NEW BREAK PADS, RAISE DERRICK, RIG UP FLOOR AND ROTARY TOOLS,
KELLYANDSWIVELAND FINIISH UP WITH FLARE LINESAND ANCHORS

9/17/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 iWHD 1 CUT OFF CASINGAND CONDUCTOR AND WELD ON 9 5/8 WELL HEAD AND
TEST TO 1000 PSI

10:00 -11:00 1.00 WHD 1 LET WELL HEAD COOL DOWN
11:00 -00:30 13.50 BOP 1 NIPPLE UP 5M BOPS, NIPPLE UP BOTHSIDESMANUALVALVES, CHOKE

HOSE & WELD FLOW TO FIT ROTATING HEAD.
00:30 -01:30 1.00 BOP 1 TORQUE UP KELLY FI TESTING
01:30 -06:00 4.50 BOP 2 TEST BOPS-TEST KELLYVALVESLOW (250 PSI) 5 MIN HIGH(5000 PSI) 10

MIN- FLOOR VALVES, PIPE RAMS, BLIND RAMS, MANUALVALVES, HCR, AND
CHOKE MANIFOLD, (250 PSI) LOW 5 MIN (5000 PSI) HIGH 10 MIN.- ANNULAR
(250 PSI )LOW 5 MIN (3500 PSI )HIGH 10 MIN

9/18/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 EQT 1 PUMP UP AND TEST CASING (1500 PSI )15 MIN
07:00 -08:00 1.00 BOP 1 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
08:00 - 11:00 3.00 STRAP BHAAND CLEAN UP SUB AND FLOOR AFTER NIPPLE UP AND TEST
11:00 - 16:00 5.00 RIG 2 REPAIR DWKS BRAKESWOULD NOT MOVE BLOCKSWITHOUT REVERSE

BLOCK DOWN. ADJUSTED AND AND CHANGE THE SPRING PLACEMENT.
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 -22:00 5.50 TRP 1 PICK UP 8 3/4- 504 ZX, SQUARE MOTOR, BHA AND 4 1/2 DP.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 LEVEL DERRICK
22:30 -01:30 3.00 TRP 3 CONTINUE PICKING UP 4 1/2 DP
01:30 -04:00 2.50 RIG 2 RIG REPAIR- WORK ON CATHEAD MAKEUP SIDE THE CHAIN WILL SUCK IN

Printed: 10/4/2007 1:02:15 PM

RECEIVED
0CTO52007



Questar E & P Page 2 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

9/18/2007 01:30 -04:00 2.50 RIG 2 THE CATHEAD AT A FAST RATE OF SPEED WITH OUT USING THE LEVER
SHUT DOWN TO FIX ALLSOTHE KELLY SPINNERSNOT WORKING. GOT
KELLY SPINNERS WORKING

04:00 -05:00 1.00 LEVEL DERRICK
05:00 -06:00 1.00 BOP 1 INSTALL ROTATING RUBBERAND OILER LINES

9/19/2007 06:00 -06:30 0.50 TEST PUMPS & R/U WIRE LINE MACHINE
06:30 - 07:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
07:00 - 10:00 3.00 DRL 1 TAGUP CEMENT @2165 DRLGCEMENT Fl 21650- 2260- FLOAT COLLAR @

2181 & SHOE @2225
10:00 - 11:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 2260 - 2273- PUMP SWEEP
11:00 - 11:30 0.50 EQT 2 FIT TEST - F/11.6 PPG - WI 8.3 PPG- PUMPED UP 400 PSI BLED BACK TO 377

PSI IN 15MIN.- MUD EQUIV. TO 11.46 PPG
11:30 -12:00 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY- @2194 INC. 3.0
12:00 - 17:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRLG FI 2273-2425
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY- @2360 INC. 3.2
17:30 -05:00 11.50 DRL 1 DRLG FI 2425- 2867
05:00 -05:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY- @2797
05:30 -06:00 0.50 DRL i DRLG F/2867-2898

9/20/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRLGFI 2898 - 3054
10:00 -10:30 0.50 DRL 1 WORK ON PUMPS
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLG FI 3054 -3086

11:00 -11:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE - CHANGE OUT AIR MOTOR F/ AUTO DRILLER AND PUMP UP
WT. INDACATOR.

11:30 - 16:00 4.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ DRLG Fl 3086 - 3366
16:00 -17:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC& SURVEY @3251 INC. 2.2
17:00 - 01:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRLGFI 3366-3926
01:30 - 02:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @3856 2.3
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 DRL 1 DRLGFI 3926-4130

9/21/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 4130-4425
11:30 - 12:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY- @4349 2.0 INC
12:30 - 15:30 3.00 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 4425- 4642
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:00 - 21:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRLGFl 4642- 4922
21:00 - 22:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC. &SURVEY @4852
22:00 - 06:00 8.00 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 4922- 5310

9/22/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 5310-5420
08:30 -09:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @5344 INC2.7
09:30 - 16:00 6.50 DRL 1 DRLGFI 5420 - 5605
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
16:30 - 04:30 12.00 DRL 1 DRLG FI 5605-5944
04:30 -05:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @5874 MISRUN
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 5944-5954

9/23/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 5954-5976
06:30 -07:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @5900 INC. 2.5
07:30 - 16:00 8.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 5976- 6282
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 22:00 5.50 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 6282- 6468
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @6399 2.6
23:00 -06:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 6468-6568

9/24/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 6658-6830- MOTOR PRESSURED UP
13:30 -14:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC. BTM UP
14:30 -16:00 1.50 TRP 13 TRIP OUT MOTOR STARTED TO PRESSURE UP
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 FLOW CHECK- THE TRIP TANK NOT WORK RIGHT PASON PROBLEM-

Printed: 10/4/2007 1:02 15



Questar E & P Page 3 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

9/24/2007 16:00 - 16:30 0.50 STRAPED TANK TO KEEP TRACK - FLOW WENT FROM 3/4" FLOW TO
NOTHING,ITHINK JUST FLOW LINE DRIANINGBECAUSE IT QUIT FAST.

16:30 -20:30 4.00 TRP 13 FINISH TRIPPINGOUTOF HOLE- HOLE TOOK 23 BBLSOVER CALCULATIONS
20:30 - 22:30 2.00 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT MOTOR & BIT- WENT FI SQUARE .25 TO A HUNTING.15

22:30 -00:30 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN TO SHOE
00:30 -01:00 0.50 CIRC 1 INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER & BREAK CIRC.
01:00 -03:30 2.50 TRP 2 FINISH TRIP IN HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE
03:30 -04:30 1.00 REAM 1 SAFETY REAM F/6789-6830
04:30 - 06:00 1.50 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 6830-6870

9/25/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRLGFl 6870-6973
11:00 -12:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC& SURVEY @6890- INC 3.0
12:00 - 15:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 6973-7065
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30 - 03:00 11.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 7065-7345
03:00 -04:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC. & SURVEY @7269-INC 2.8
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRLG F/7345-7392

9/26/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DRL 1 DRLG F / 7392- 7622
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 04:00 11.50 DRL 1 DRLGF/7622- 7777 - LAST 10 HRSAVG. 12.4 FT HR
04:00 - 05:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC BTM'SUP
05:00 -06:00 1.00 SUR 1 DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL

9/27/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 TRP 10 TOH CHANGE BITS
10:30 - 16:30 6.00 TRP 10 TIH BIT #3 504 ZX
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH 60' TO BOTTOM AS PRECAUTION
17:00 -06:00 13.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 7777' TO 7990'

9/28/2007 06:00 - 15:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 7990' TO 8211'
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 -23:30 7.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8211' TO 8300'- ROP DROPPED OFF TO 6' HR.
23:30 -01:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & CONDITION MUD FOR BIT TRIP
01:00 -06:00 5.00 TRP 10 TOH WITH BIT#3

9/29/2007 06:00 -09:00 3.00 TRP 10 FINISHED TOH CHANGE BITS&MUD MOTOR (HUNTING0.15)
09:00 - 10:00 1.00 TRP 10 TIH TO 2200'
10:00 -11:30 1.50 RIG 6 CUT DRILL LINE
11:30-14:00 2.50 TRP 10 TIHBIT#4
14:00 -14:30 0.50 REAM i WASH & REAM 60' TO BOTTOM - PRECAUTION
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8300' TO 8303'
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
15:30 - 03:30 12.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8303' TO 8457'
03:30 -04:00 0.50 RIG 2 REPAIR LINE GUIDE
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8457' TO 8492'

9/30/2007 06:00 - 15:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8492' TO 8643'
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 - 06:00 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8643' TO 8762'

10/1/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8762' TO8800'

NOTIFIED BLM (CLIFF JOHNSON VOICE MAIL0 OF UPCOMING CASING &
CEMENT JOB

11:00 -12:00 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP HI VISSWEEP & CIRC. AROUND
12:00 -13:00 1.00 TRP 14 10 STAND WIPER TRIP - HOLE SLICK
13:00 -15:00 2.00 CIRC 1 PUMP HI VIS SWEEP & CIRC. OUT
15:00 -21:00 6.00 TRP 2 TOH - SLM - L/D M.M. - MONEL -2 STBS.
21:00 -22:00 1.00 LOG 1 SAFETY MEETING&RIGUP LOGGING ADAPTOR &HOWCOLOGGINGTOOLS
22:00 -02:00 4.00 LOG 1 RAN TRIPLE COMBO FROM 8800' TO 2262'

Printed: 10/4/2007 1:02:15





Fonn3160.5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(November 199‡) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR °ÊŽ°ü

i i
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5 Lease Serial No.

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTSONWELLS UTU-77301
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill or reenter en 6. Iffndian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD)for such proposals,

N/A
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Offrer Instructions on reverse side BIGVALLEYUNIT UTU-81308X

1. TypeofWell

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.
2, Name of Operator NBZ 8D-31-8-24
QuestarExploration &Production 9. APÏWell No.
3a Address 3b Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-37238
1571 East 1700 South Vernal. Utah 84078 435-781-4331 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4 Location ofWell (Footage, Sec.,T.,R., M, or SurveyDescription) UNDESIGNATED
1581' FNL 1233' FEL, SENE, SECTION 31, TBS, R24E 11. County or Parish,State

UINTAH
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
O Subsequent Report CasingRepair New Construction Recomplete Omer

ChangePlans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
O Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Opera1ions (clearly staic all pertinent detaits, including esdmated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereofIf the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplele horizontally. Sive subsurface locations and meamred and true vertical depths of ai pertinent markers and zonesA1tach the Bond under which ite work will be performed or provide the Bond Na on flie with BLM/BIA Required subscquent reporis shad be filed within 30 daysFollowing cornpletion of Ihe involved operatiomt If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a now interval, a Farm 3160-4 shall be filed onceTesting has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shai be filed only af1er all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator hasdelermined that the sile is ready for fmal inspection)

Questar Exploration&Production requests authorizationto sidetrack thiswellbore. On October 25th approximately7,628' of
the drill stringwas accidentallydropped in the hole. The current drilling depth ofthewell is 13,143'. Fishingoperations have
recovered 7,259' of the drillpipe leaving 369' in the hole withthetopat 12,774'. Subsequent operations so far have failed to
recover the remaining369'. In the event it becomes necessary: Questar proposes to set an open hole screw-in typewhipstock
and would thenkick off in order to continue operations to reach thebottom hole objective. Attached is a description of thistool.
The sidetrack wouldaffect only the bottom 650' - 750' of the holewithan estimated totaldepth of 13,450'.

Please contact Jan Nelson at (435) 781-4331 if you need further documentation. All technicalquestions can be addressed to
Steven Hall,DrillingEngineer, at (303) 672-6919 or cell (303) 916-1990.

14. I hereby ceÑTy•tbatthe foregoing is trueand correct
Name (Prinre Title

Jan Nels equlatroryAffairs

THISSPACE FOR FEDERALORS
Approv Title ate

Conditions of approval, ifany, areattached. Approval ofthis notice does not warrant or certify MCC
thatthe applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title18 US C. Section100I, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of t
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Open Hole Screw-in Type oxHOn

Whipstock
- DrillString

Scope
The followingprocedures are intended toprovide Instructionsforassembling,runningtotargetdepth, engagingthefish and cementing(ifrequired)usingtheScrew-InType
Whipstock.

+- nunningTool
Equipment Required $1bniue
• Screw·ln Type Whipstock
• AttachmentDevice
• SettingTool
• Orientation Device (UBHO,MWD,etc.) *¯¯ (*""a
• DrillPlpe Joint
• Pup joints(forspace-outifnecessary)
• Assembly Tools and Equipment

Recommendations
The Weatherford Screw-In Type Whipatock,althoughset in openhole conditlonS, San--In peshouldbe screwedintoorattachedtoa stationaryfish or stringtoprevent it frommovingdownholewhensetting.Depending uponwhich attachmentmethodis utilized,theScrew.In typeWhipstockmayor maynotbe orientedin a specificdirection.
Ifrequired,theScrew-InTypeWhipatockcan also be cementedin place ifcirculating
ports are included in theBHAor attachmentdevice thatis utilized.
IftheScrew -InType WhipstockassemblyIs utilizedas a cementstyleassemblywithtallpipe,it is stronglyadvisedby Weatherford thatinwellbores withmorethan5°
Inclinationthewhipstockbe orientatedfor high side departure to mitigategravitational - sonapmovementfmm thewellborewell.

Wessie®id ploducia and servicesare sulgactin amComp-fa siendeniCasing Exits 1 of 11 a.r...nu ennu..........u.......e ..t..........um. v.,mole hiermaion coniactan mihodzedWealheard Impielerimin. UnlessnoledoRamles. Indemade and usivisemerla heisin sie sie pinpanyofWestlinit SpeCEcainns ale aligentin changeulBinut noSee,

e20osew.ameland



11 8 2007 Rachel Medina - 8D-31-8-24 DRL . df a e 1

WellName: NBZ 8D-31-8-24ST-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

8/30/2007 06:00 -00:00 18.00 LOC 3 MIRU
0000-05:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILLEDO/119f
05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 10 BIT TRIP

8/31/2007 06:03 - 20:30 14.50 DRL 1 DRILL 1190 I 182& - WATER FLOW @163Œ
20;30 -01:30 5.00 TRP 10 BIT TRIP
01:30 - 06:00 4.50 DRILL 1820 /1997

Sfil2007 06:00 -13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL 199& /2269
13:00 - 14:00 1.00 TRP 3 LD.D.P.
14:00 -16:30 2.50 CSG 2 RAN 221& 95/S' 36/t CASING
16:30 -17:00 0.50 CMT 2 CElvENT CASING 760 SKS. CLASS G
17:00 - 06:00 13.00 LOC 8 R/D & RELEASERIG

9/11/2007 06'00 - 19:00 13.00 LOC 3 MOVE IN RIG 90% MOVED IN - SET MAT BOARDS / SUB BASE / INSTAL
SPREADER BEAMS ON SUB

NOTIFIED CLIFF JOHNSON BLM Ol¯
MDVING ON LOCATION

19:00 - 06:00 11.00 LOC 4 RIG IDLE WAIT ON DAYUGHT
9/12/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 R/U RIG35% - REPAIR DWKSBRAKES&DRUM - BREAK D0WN DERRICK

FOR INSPECTION - TRUCKS RELEASED @1700 HR.
18;00 - 06:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG IDLE WAITING ON DAYLIGHT

9/13/2007 0600 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG UP45%- SAND BLAST PIN POCKETS ON DERRICK,A-LEG S,DERRICK
SHOES, DEAD-MAN ACHOR,CROWN AND CRAZE WHEEL MAGNA FLUX
SAME.- CHANGED OUT BREAK FI.ANGES ON DWKS. CHANGED RADIATOR
ON #2 PUMP MOTÓR AND WORK ON ACHORS FOR NEW FLARE LINES

18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG IDLE WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
9/14/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LÒC 4 RIG UP- PUT DWKSBACK TOGETHER,PRIMER AND PAINT SPOT ON

DERRICK THAT WAS CHECKED, HELP WELDERS BUILDFLARE LINE ACHORS
AND PUT FLARE LINE TOGETHER.

9/15/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG UP - 70% - PUTDERRICK BACK TOGETHER AFTER INSPECTIONAND
FlNISHSETTING RIG IN -FLARE BOX AND BAR HOPPERS

18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG IDLE - WAFTON DAYUGHT
9/16/2007 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 LOC 4 RIG UP - 100%- STRING UP BLOCKS, PREPARE DERRICK TO RAISE,BURN IN

NEW BREAK PADS, RAISE DERRICK, RIGUP FLOOR AND ROTARY T00LS,
KELLY AND SWIVELAND FINIISH UPWITH I¯LARE LINES AND ANCHORS

9/17/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 WHD 1 CUT OFF CASING AND CONDUCTOR AND WELD ON 9 5/8 WELL HEAD AND
TEST TO 1000 PSI

1000 - 11:00 1.00 WHD 1 LET WELL HEAD COOL DOWN
11:00 -0030 13.50 BOP 1 NIPPLEUP5M BOPS, NIPPLE UPBOTH SIDES MANUAL VALVES, CHOKE

HOSE &WELD FLOW TO FIT ROTATING HEAD.
00 30 - 01:30 1.00 BÖP 1 TORQUE UP KELLY FI TESTING
01:30 - 06:00 4.50 BOP 2 TEST BOPS- TEST KELLY VALVES LOW (250 PSI) 5 MlN HIGH (5000 PSI) 10

MlN- FLOOR VALVES, PIPE RAMS, BUND RAMS, MANUALVALVES, HCR,AND
CHOKE MANIIÓLD, (250 PSI) LOW S MIN (5000 PSI) HIGH 10 MIN.- ANNULAR
(250 PS1 )LOW 5 MIN (3500 PSI )HIGH 10 MIN

9/18/2007 0600 - 07:00 1.00 EQT 1 PUMP UPAND TEST CASING (1500 PSI )15 MIN
07:00 -0800 1.00 BOP 1 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
08:00 -11:00 3.00 STRAP BHAAND CLEAN UP SUB AND FLOOR AFTER NIPPLE UPAND TEST
11:00 -16:00 5.00 RIG 2 REPAIR DWKS BRAKES WOULD NOT MOVE BLOCKS WITHOUTREVERSE

BLOCKDOWN. ADJUSTED AND AND CHANGE THE SPRING PLACEMENT.
16:00 -16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 22:00 5.50 TRP 1 PICK UP 8 3/4 504 ZX, SQUARE MOTOR, BHA AND4 1/2 DP.
22:00 -22:30 0.50 LEVEL DERRICK
2230-01:30 3.00 TRP 3 CONTINUEPICKINGUP41/2DP
01:30 -04:00 2.50 RIG 2 RIG REPAIR- WORK ON CATHEAD MAKEUP S1DE THE CHAIN WILLSUCK IN

Printed: 11/7/2007 7:32'28 AM

RECEIVED
NOVO8 2007

DIV.0F01L,GAS&
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Questar E & P Page 2of 11

Operations Summary Report

WellName: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number 111

Date From -To Hours Code C Descnption of Operations

W1W2007 01:30 - 04:00 2.50 RIG 2 THE CATHEAD AT A FAST RATE OF SPEED WITH OUT USING THE LEVER
SHUT DOWN TO FIX ALLSO THE KELLY SPINNERS NOT WORKING. GOT
KELLYSPINNERSWORKING

04:00 -05:00 1.00 LEVEL DERRICK
05:00 -06:00 1.00 BOP 1 INSTALL ROTATINGRUBBERAND OILERLINES

9/1W2007 0600 -06:30 0.50 TEST PUMPS &R/U WIRE LINE MACHINE
06;30 -07:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
07;00 - 10:00 3.00 DRL 1 TAG UPCFMENT @2165 DRLG CEMENTF/21650 2260- FLOAT COLLAR @

2181 &SHOE @2225
10:00 - 11:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRLG FI2260 - 2273- PUMP SWEEP
11:00 - 11:30 0.50 EQT 2 FIT TEŠT - F/11.6 PPG - WIS.3 PPG- PUMPED UP400 PSI BLED BACK TO 377

PSI IN 15MIN.- MUD EQUIV. TO 11.46 PPG
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE UNE SURVEY- @2194 INC. 3.0
1200-17:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRLGF/2273-2425
17:00 -17:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY- @2360 INC.3.2
17:30 -05:00 11.50 DRL 1 DRLGF/2425- 2867
05;00 - 05:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY- @2797
05 30 - 06:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/2867-2898

9/20f2007 0600 -10:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRLGF/2898 -3054

10;00 - 10:30 0.50 DRL 1 WORK ON PUMPS
10:30-11:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLGFl3054 -3086

11:00 -11:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE - CHANGEOUTAIR MOTOR F/AUTO DRILLER AND PUMP UP
WT. INDACATOR.

11:30-16:00 4.50 DRL 1 DRLGI"/DRLGFI3086-3366
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC& SURVEY @3251 INC. 2.2
17:00-01:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRLGF/3366-3926
01:30 -02:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC&SURVEY@3856 2.3
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 3926-4130

9/21/2007 06'00-11:30 5.50 DRL 1 DRLGFl4130-4425
11:30 -1230 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC&SURVEY-@4349 2.0 INC
12:30 -15:30 3.00 DRL 1 DRLGF/4425- 4642
15:30 -16:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:00 -21:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRLGFld642- 4922
21:00-22:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC.&SURVEY@4852
22:00 -06:00 8.00 DRL 1 DRLG F/4922- 5310

9/22/2007 06:00-08:30 2.50 DRL 1 DRLGF/5310-5420
08:30-0930 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC&SURVEY@5344 INC2.7
0930-16:00 6.50 DRL 1 DRLGF/5420-5605
1600-16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
16:30-04:30 12.00 DRL 1 DRLGF/5605-5944
0430-05:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC&SURVEY@5874 MISRUN
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 5944-5954

9/23/2007 06:00-06:30 0.50 DRL 1 DRLGFl5954-5976
06:30 -07:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC&SURVEY@5900 INC.2.5
07:30 -16:00 8.50 DRL 1 DRLGF/5976- 6282
16:00 -16:30 0.50 R1G 1 RIGSERVICE
16:30-22:00 5.50 DRL 1 DRLGFI6282-6468
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC &SURVEY @6399 2.6
23:00-06:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRLGF/6468-6568

9/24/2007 06:00 -13:30 7.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/6658-6830- MOTOR PRESSURED UP
13:30 - 14:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC. BTM UP
14:30 - 16:00 1.50 TRP 13 TRIP OUT MOTOR STARTED TO PRESSURE UP
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 FLOW CHECK- THE TRIP TANK NOT WORK RIGHT PASON PROBLEM-

P(nted: 11/7/2007 7:32:26
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QuestarE&P Page3of11

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number 111

Date From -To Hours Code CA Description of Operations

9/24/2007 16:00 - 16:30 0.50 STRAPED TANKTOKEEP TRACK-FLOW WENT FROM 3/4" FLOWTO
NGTHING,iTHINK JUST FLOW LINE DRIANING BECAUSE IT QUIT FAST.

16:30 - 20:30 4.00 TRP 13 FINISHTRIPPING OUT OF HOLE- HOLE TOOK 23BBLS OVER CALCULATIONS
20'30 - 22:30 2.00 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT MOTOR &BIT- WENT F/SQUARE .25 TO A HUNTING .15

22:30 - 00:30 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP INTO SH0r
00:30 -01;00 0.50 CIRC 1 INSTALL R0TATINGRUBBER&BREAKCIRC.
01:00 -03:30 2.50 TRP 2 FINISH TRIP IN HÓLE IN GOOD SHAPE
03:30 - 04:30 1.00 REAM 1 SAFETY REAM F/6789-6830
04:30-06:00 1.50 DRL 1 DRLGF/6830-6870

W25/2007 08:00 - 11:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRLG FI 6870-6973
11:00 - 12:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC &SURVEY @6890- INC 3.0
1200-15:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRLGF/6973-iC65
15:00 -15:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
15:30-03:00 11.50 DRL 1 DRLGFl7065-7345
03:00-04:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC.&SURVEY@7269-INC2.8
04 00 - 06;00 2.00 DRL 1 DRLG F/7345-7392

9/26/2001 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DRL 1 DRLG F I 7392- 7622
16:00-16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
16:30 - 04:00 11.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/7622- T/TI - LAST 10 HRS AVG.12.4 FT HR
0400 -05;00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCBTMS UP
05:00-06:00 1.00 SUR 1 DROPSURVEY&PUMPPILL

9/2i/2007 0600-10:30 4.60 TRP 10 TOHCHANGEBITS
10:30 - 16;30 6.00 TRP 10 TIH BIT #3 504 ZX
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH 60' TO BOTTOM AS PRECAUTION
17:00 -06:00 13.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM777T TO799Œ

9/28/2007 06:00 -15:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM7990' TÒ8211'
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 - 23:30 7.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8211' TO 8300 - ROP DROPPED OFF TO 6' HR.
23:30 - 01:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & CONDITION MUD FOR BIT TRIP
01:00 - 06:00 5.00 TRP 10 TOH WITH BIT#3

9/29/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 TRP 10 FINISHED TOH CHANGE BITS & MUD MOTOR (HUNTINGO.15)
09:00 - 10:00 1.00 TRP 10 TlH TO 2207
10:00-11:30 1.50 RIG 6 CUTDRILLLINE
11:30 - 14:00 2.50 TRP 10 TIH BIT #4
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM 60' TO BOTTOM - PRECAUTION
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8300' TO 8303'
15:00 -15:30 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
15:30 -03:30 12.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8303' TO8457
03:30 - 04:00 0.50 RIG 2 REPAIR LINE GUIDE
04:00-06:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRILLEDFROM8457TO8492'

9/30/2007 06:00 - 15:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8492' TO 8643'
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 - 06:00 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8643' TO 8762'

1011/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8762' TO 8800'

NOTIFIED BLM (CLIFF JOHNSON VOICE MAIL OOF UPCOM1NG CASING &
CEMENT JOB

11:00 -12:00 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP HIVIS SWErP &CIRC.AROUND
12:00-13:00 1.00 TRP 14 10STANDWIPERTRIP-HOLESUCK
13:00 -15:00 2.00 CIRC 1 PUMP HIVIS SWEFP &C1RC.OUT
15:00 - 21:00 6.00 TRP 2 TOH - SLM - UD M.M. - MONEL - 2 STBS.
21:00 - 22:00 1.00 LOG 1 SAFETYMEETING & RIG UP LOGGING ADAPTOR & HOWCÓLOGGING TOOLS
22:00 - 02:00 4.00 LOG 1 RAN TRIPLE COMBO FROM 8800' TO 2262'

Prbted 11/7/2007 7:32:26
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Questar E&P Page 4of 11

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location 31- 8-8 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number 111

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

10/1/2007 0200 -03:00 1.00 LOG 1 R/D MOWCO LOGGING TOOLS
03:00 -06:00 3.00 TRP 15 TlH WITH TRICONEBIT&SLICK BHA

10/2/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 TRP 15 TIH TRICONE BIT SUCK BHA
07:30 - 09:00 1.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM 12Œ TO BOTTOM AS PRECAUTlÖN - NO FILL
0900 -1000 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC.BOTTOMS UP
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 TRP 3 SAFETY MEETING - RIU UD TRUCK
10:30 - 15:00 4.50 TRP 3 L.D.D.P. 4 1/2"
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 RIG 2 REPAIR BREAK OUT UNE
16:00 -20:30 4.50 TRP 3 LD.D.P.
2030 -21:00 0.50 OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
21:00 - 00:00 3.00 CSG 1 R/U ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING TOOLS
0000 - 06:00 6.00 CSG 2 RAN 7" - 26# - P-110 CASING

10/3/2007 0600-06:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.CASING@500J
06:30 -11:30 5.00 CSG 2 RAN T'28# P-110 LT&CCASING TOTAL 192 JTS
11:30 - 14:00 2.50 CIRC. 1 CASING STACKED OUT @8754 - CIRC. AND CONDITION MUD TO 11.2 IN

11.2OUT - HEAVY PACKING ÓFF TRYING TOGET PAST 8754 - LARGE
AMOUNT OF HEAVING SHALE OVER SHAKERS -AFTER2 HRS. SHALE
CLEARED UP BUT CONTINUE PACKING OFF BELOW 8754'

SHOE @8807 - FLOAT @8753'
14:00 - 16:00 2.00 CMT 1 RIG UP HOWCO CEMENTERS - CIRC.WHILE RIGGING UP CEMENTERS -

SAFETY MEETING
16:00 -20:00 4.00 CMT 2 CEMENT WITH 300 SK. 11# HI FILL YLD 3.84 LEAD SLURRY-950 SK. 14.3

YLD. 1.24 POZ PREM TAIL- DISPLACED Wl334 BBL 11.2 MUD - NO CEMENT
TO SURFACE - BUMP PLUG 3000 PSI. - FLOATS HELD

2000-20:30 0.50 CMT 1 RIGDOWNHOWOOCEMENTERS
2Œ30 - 23:30 3.00 BOP 1 UNBOLT BOP STACK
23:30 - 01:30 2.00 CSG 7 UFT STACK- SET CSG. SUPS WITH 200K WT. ON SUPS - ROUGH CUT

CASING
01:30 - 05:00 3.50 BOP 1 NIPPLE DOWN & LAY OUT BOPS
05:00 -06:00 1.00 WHD 1 DRESS CASING STUB & NIPPLE UP B SECTION

DRESS 7" CASING STUB - NIPPLE UP B SECTION

NOTIFIED BLM CLIFF JOHNSON VOICE MAIL OF CASING & CEMENT JOS AND
GAVE NOTICE ON TESTING BOPS @0430 HRS. 1Œ03/2007

10/4/2007 06:00-0630 0.50 WHD 1 NIPPLEUP71/1610KX11"5KBSECTION
TEST 5K

06:30 - 14:30 8.00 BOP 1 NIU BOP & PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT &P/U KELLY
14:30-20:30 6.00 BOP 2 TESTBOPBLIND/PIPERAMS25Œ10K-CHOKE&KILL MANIFOLDHCRVALVE

AND ALLGATE VALVES 25Œ10K - TIWKELLY COCKS & ISOP 25Œ10K -

HYDRIL 25Œ5000 - EA. TEST 10 MIN. CHARTED BYB&C TESTERS - TEST
CASING 1500 PSI. 30 MIN.
KOOMY FUNCTION&PRECHARGE

20:30 - 2330 3.00 BOP 1 NIPPLE UP ROTATING HEAD &ATTEMPT TO HOOK UP FLOW UNE - WOULD
NOT UNE UP- CALLED ½ELDER

23:30 - 02:30 3.00 OTH LAYOUT & STRAP SUM HOLE BHA & 4" D.P.
CHANGE UNERS SWABS IN MUD PUMPS FROMS"IO 5"
RIU LAYDOWN TRUCK

0230-05:00 2.50 BOP 1 WELDERREFAB&FINISHHOOKUPFLOWLINE
05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 1 P/U SUM HOLE BHA

10/5/2007 0600-13:00 7,00 TRP 1 PlUSUMHOLEDRILLSTRINGlihto400f
13:00 - 16:00 3.00 TRP 2 DRILL STRING PLUGGED -TOH WET PIPE - FÓUNDFLOAT IN TOP OF MUD

MOTOR UPSIDE DOWN

Printact 11/7/2007 7:32:26
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NB2 8D-31-8-24 ST-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Locatiort 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

10/5/2007 16:00 - 18:30 2.50 TRP 2 TIH TO 400Œ & FILL PIPE
18;30 -19:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.
19:00 - 23:30 4.50 TRP 1 P/U 4" D.P.
23:30-00:00 0.50 ClRC 1 CIRC.@8078'
00 00 - 01:00 1.00 TRP 1 P/U 4" D.P. TAG OUT @8623'
01:00 -01:30 0.50 0TH RID LAYD0WN TRUCK
01:30 -05:00 3.50 DRL 4 DRILL CEMENT FROMS6433' -8800 + 1Œ NEWHOLE'
05:00 - 05:30 0.50 EQT 2 FIT - 13.59 EMW
05:30 -06:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FR0MBSOD TO3842'

10/&2007 06:00 - 15'30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8842' TO9332'
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00-06:00 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLEDFROM9332'TO10,13T

10f//2007 06'00 - 16:30 10.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 10,13T TO 10,498'
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
17:00 -06:00 13.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 10,498' TO10,95f

10/&2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 10,950' T0 11,21& - RAISING MUD WT. TO 12.9
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.& FINISH RAISING MUD WT. TO12.9
13:30 - 15:30 2.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 11,21& TO 11,295'
15:30 - 17:30 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC.OUTGAS FROM 20 BBL. PIT GAIN & RAISE MUD WT. TO 13.3
17:30 - 20:00 2.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 11,295' TO il,438' - RAISlNG MUD WT. TO 13.4
20:00 -23:00 3.00 OTH CIRC. WITH 13.4 MUD WT. &WAIT ON BARITE BULK TRUCKS
23:00 - ©:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 11,438' TO 11,612' - MUD WT. 13.6
02:00 - CIRC 1 GAS BUBBLE TOSURFACE TOOK 40 BBL PIT GAIN AND 6f FLARE - SHUT IN

AND CIRC.& CONDITION MUD WT. TO 13.9 GOING THRU THE CHOKE
10/9/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.OUT GAS ON CHOKE & BRING UP MUD WT. FROM 13.6 TO 13.9 -

FLARE 4Œ
07:30-15:30 8.00 ORL 1 DRILLEDFROM11,612' TO11,86f
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 - 06:00 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 11,86Œ TO12,12T

10/10/2007 06:00 - 15:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 12,12T TO 12,346'
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 -06:00 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM12,346' TO12,63Œ

10/11/2007 06:00 - 14:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 12,630' TO 12768
14:30 - 17:00 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC & COND RAISE MUD WT TO 14.8PPG
17:00-17:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
17:30 -19:30 2.00 DRL 1 DRLGFI12768TO12800
19:30 -20:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH &REAM TIGHT CONNECTION
2000 - 23:30 3.50 CIRC 6 CIRC.& COND BUILD VOLUME LOST PARTIAL RETURNSAPPROX. 150 BBL

PUMP SWEEPS GOT ALL RETURNSBACK
23:30-01:00 1.50 DRL 1 DRLFF/12800TO12819
01:00 -06:00 5.00 CIRC 6 CIRC.&COND.BU1LD VOLUME LOST PARTIAL RETURNSAGAIN LOST

APPROX. 100 BBL MAINTANE MUD WT.14.7 PPG. AIR BLOWER FIBAR
HOPPER WENT DOWN HAD TO REPLACE OUT OF EVANSTON WYO. USE
SACK BARWHILE WAITING

10/12/2007 06:00 - 12:00 6.00 CIRC 6 CIRC. &BUILD MUD VOLUME & WT. 14.6 PPG.- LOST APPROX. 150 BBLS.
12:00 -13:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRLGF/12819 TO12833
13:30-14:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
14:00 -03'30 13.50 DRL 1 DRLGF/12833 TO12931- PUMP LCMSWEEPS AFTER EACH CONN.AND

DURING AS NEED FOR SEEPAGE
03:30 -06:00 2.50 CIRC 6 CIRC.BUILD VOLUME PACKOFF &SEEPAGE BUILDVOLUME LOST APPROX.

140 BBLS
10/13/2007 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 CIRC 6 CIRC. AND ATTEMPT TORAISE MUD WT. TO 15PPG AND LOST MDST

RETURUNSAT A14.6 PPG PUMP HIGH LCM SWEEPS AND WORKING ON

Prbted: 11/7/2DD7 7:32:26
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Operations Summary Report

WellName: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Locatiort 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number 111

Date From -To Hours Code C e Descnption of Operations

10/13/2007 0600 -06:00 24.00 CIRC 6 RAISING THEACTIVE TO15% OR BETTER IN LCM. LOST APPROX. 480 BBLß
IN 24 HRS.HOLE ACTING OK.

10/14/2007 06:00-08:30 2.50 CIRC 6 CIRC&COND.BUILDVOLUMEMUDWT.15PPG,BUILDLCMCÓNTENTTO20
%

08:30 -14:30 6.00 DRL 1 DLRGF/12931 TO12954
14:30 - 06:00 15.50 CIRC 6 CIRC& COND. BUILD VOLUME, RAISE MUD WT 15 PPG. BUlKLD LCM

CONTENT TO 20%
10/15/2007 06:00-15:00 9.00 CIRC 6 CIRC.&COND.BRINGLCMCONTENTTO20%STABUZEMUDWT.TÓ14.8

USED 80 BBLS OF 15.5 MUD TO FEED IN SYSTEM
15:00 -16:00 1.00 WCL 3 FLOW CHECK- FIRST 16MN 2.5 BBLS TO1.4 BBLSMIN-SFCÓND 15MIN 1.4

BBLS TO.77 BBLS MIN-THIRD 15 MIN..TT BBLS STEADY.
16:00 -17:30 1.50 CIRC 6 CIRC.COND.-CIRCBTMS UP AFTER FLOW CHECKANDMAINTAIN MUD WT

14.8 PPG AND LCM CONTENT 20% BUILD VOLUME
17:30-18:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
18:00 -02:30 8.50 CIRC 1 CIRC AND COND. PLANS TO DO A10 STD SHORT TRIPSP0TED A 16.8 PPG

PILL WOULD NOT HOLD STATIC HAD 200 PSI ON STAND PIPI¯ PUMPED IT
0UT.SPOTED ANOTHER 17.4 PPG

02 30 - 04 00 1.50 TRP 14 SHORT TRIP 10 STDS-FLOWEFD BACK 82.3 BBLS DURING TRIP
04:00 -06:00 2.00 CIRC 6 CIRC&BUILD VOLUME LOST APPROX. 200 BBLS CIRCHEAVY PIU..OUT

10/1&2007 06:00 - 17:30 11.50 CIRC 1 CIRULATE OUT HEAVEY PILL & PUMP LCM SWEEPS & REGAIN CIRC.( LOST
APROX. 250 BBLS )

17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
18 00 - 20:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & MAINTAIN MUD WT. 14.6
2030 -23:00 2.50 WCL 3 FLOW CHECK( WEU.. FLOWED 75BBLS )
23:00 - 02:30 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRC GAS OUT (800 STROKES RAWGAS, GAINED 39BBLS )
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT TO THE SHOE

10/17/2007 0600 -07:00 1.00 RIG 6 CUTDRLGLINE
07:00 -0930 2.50 CIRC 1 WELL STARTTO FLOW ABOUT 3/4" STREAM,SO PICK UPKELLY STARTED

CIRCULATING HAD A FLARE RIGHT AWAY 2/5' BTMS UP GAVE A2Œ3Œ FLARE
BUILT A1LLS OVER PIU. 15.6 SPOT AT SHOE. STOPPED PUMPSFLOWED
BACK 12 BBLS.

09:30-11:00 1.50 TRP 2 STARTEDTOTRIPOUTPULLED7STANDSSLOWANDONEACHSTAND
SWABBING .5TO 1 BBL PER STAND PLUS CAP. OF THE STAND SO IT
AVERAGE OUT TO 2/2.5 BBLSA STAND. TRIP BACK TO SHOE

11:00 - 14:30 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRC OUT GASAND RAISE MUD WT. BACK TO A 14.6 PPG AND MAINTAIN.
BUILD AND PUMPA16.2 PILL 3BBLS SPOT ATTHE SHOE.

14:30 -16:30 2.00 TRP 2 FLOW CHECK-FLOWED BACK 50 BBLS IN 20 MIN. PULLED 7 STANDS
SWABBING .5 TO 1 BBL PER STAND BUT NOT CAP.

16:30 - 19:30 3.00 CIRC 1 CIRC GAS OUT AND MAINTAIN14.6PPG MUD WT FLARESŒ20'
19 30 - 20:00 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN 10 STANDS FI 8878 TO 10044
20:00 -2330 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRC&COND.-CIRCULATEGASOUTANDCOND.MUD MAINTAIN14.6 MUD

WT. FLARES 10/70'
23:30 - 00:00 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN 10 STANDSF/10044 TO11039
0000-02:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC&COND.-CIRCULATEGASOUTANDCOND.MUDMAINTAIN14.6MUD

WT. FLARES 30/9¢
02 30 - 03:30 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN 10 STANDS F/11039 TO 12038
03:30 - 05:30 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC &COND.- CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND COND. MUD MAINTAIN 14.6 MUD

WT. FLARES 15/9&
05:30 -06:00 0.50 TRP 2 FINISH TRIP IN 12954

10/18/2007 06:00 - 15:30 9.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. &CÒNDITION MUD ,MAINTAIN14.6 & BRING LCM BACK UP TO 20%
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:00 - 19:00 3.00 CIRC 1 SPOT 70 BBL G-SEAL & POLLY SWELL@ 2979
1900 -20:00 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP 2PPG OVER FOR CAP&CONTROLL FLOW BACK ON DRILL STRING

Proted 11/7/2007 7:32:26
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Operations Summanj Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number 111

Date From -To Hours Code C Descnption of Operations

10/18/2007 20;00 - 23:00 3.00 TRP 10 PULL 19STANDS &CIRC BTMS UP (30 TO 40' FLARE )@11,200
23:00 -00:00 1.00 CIRC 1 SPOT 16.2 MUD Wr. @2450 STROKES& PUMP 1/2PPG OVER FOR CAP TO

CONTROLL STRING FLOW
00'00 -05:00 5.00 TRP 2 TRIPTOSHOE SLOW- WOULD NOT TAKE DISPLACEMENTOF PIPE
05:00 -06:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATEBTMSUP

10/1W2007 06'00 - 07:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC &COND. @SHOE- O-G FLARE
07:30 - 08:00 0.50 WCL 3 FLOW CHECK- WELL FLONINF 19% STAND PIPE HELD 453 DOWND TO

280PSI IN 30 MN AND GAINED 50 BBLS
08'00 - 12:00 4.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT SPOT 16.2 35 BBL PILL AT SHOE CAPED W/ 15.3 35 BBL PILL AND

TRIP17STAND SWABBINGTHEHOLE.5TO1.5 BBLSASTAND.
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC BTMS UP- 1TO 2'FLARE
13:00 - 22:30 9.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT- PUMP 16.6 PILL TRIP OUT STILL SWABBING.5TO 1 BBL PER

STAND UNTIL 15STANDS PULLED STARTED TO BREAK OVER AND TAKE
FLUID 1.5 TO 2 BBLSOVERCALCULATION PER 5 STANDS.

22'30 -02:30 4.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN- CHANGE OUT MOTOR AND P/UBIT SUB AND TRIP IN CHANGE
ROTATING HEAD RUBBERTRIP 3700

02:30 -03:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC BTMS UP-5'FLARE
03:00 - 05:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN 5895 SLOW
05:00 -06:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC &COND-WORKING ON GETTINGVIS DOWN F/93

10/2Œ2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 CIRC 1 CIRC. & COND.- VIS VERY HIGH 93 RUNDRILL THIN AND WATER TO
DEHYDRATED MUD.

10;00 - 12:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP TO SHOE- WELL FLOWED BACK 80 BBLS 34 FLOWED PLUS 46 IN TOTAL
DISPLACEMENT OF PIPE

12:00 - 14:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.& COND-STILL WORKING ON HIGH VIS MUD AND CIRC GAS OUT 15/20
FLARES

14:30 - 15:00 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN- TAG @ 9316
15:00 -22;00 7.00 REAM 1 WASH & REAM F/9316- 9532
2200 - 23:00 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN 10 STANDS F/9532 TO 10503
2300-01:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC&COND.-CIRCOUTGASANDCONDMUD
01:00 - 02:00 1.00 CIRC 1 TRIP IN 10 STANDS F/10503 TO 11600
0200 -04'00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC &COND- CIRCOUT HEAVY PILL AND MAINTAIN MUD WT 14.6 PPG. AND

BUILDLCMCONTENTBACKUPTO20%
04:00 - 05:30 1.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN FI 11500 TO 12689
05:30 -06:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC AND COND.-CIRC BTMS UP

10/21/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CIRC 1 ClRCULATE &CONDITION MUD - BIULD LCM CONTENT BACK UP & DROP
THEHIGHVIS

07:00 - 17:30 10.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM OUT OF GAGE HOLE FROM 12,642 TO 12,954
17:30 - 06:00 12.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 12,954 TO 13015

10/22/2007 06'00 - 14:00 8.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 13,020 TO 13,143
14:00 - 16:00 2.00 CIRC 2 LOST FULL RETURNS& SHUT WELL IN & SPÓT 1-40 BBL LCM POLY SWEEPS
16:00 - 17:30 1.50 TRP 2 OPEN UP WEU. BORE & SINGLE OUT 9 JOINTS WITH KELLY @12807
17:30 - 18:30 1.00 CIRC 2 SPOT 1-40 BBL LCM POLY SWEEP & PUMP 40 BBLS DOWN THE ANNULAS
18:30 -00:30 6.00 CIRC 6 BUILD VOLUME -PUMP 40BBLS MUD DOWN BACK SIDE TOSEE IF GET ANY

RETURNSBUILD200 BBLPREMIX
0030 - 03:00 2.50 CIRC 1 CLOSE ANN. OPEN HCR- CIRCTROUGH CHOKE - STARTED SEEING FLARE

@963 STKS-FLARE AROUND SU- GOT RAW GAS @2670 STKS- HOLE TOOK
131 BBLSGOT FLOW BACK @5340

03:00 - 06:00 3,00 CIRC 1 OPEN UPANN.AND STARTED CIRCULATING DOWN FLOW LINE THROUGH
BUSTER STILL LOOSING MUDAPPROX150 BBLS MORE SO FAR. BUILDING
LCM BACK UPAND VOLUME.

10/23/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 CIRC 2 SPOT ANOTHER POLY SWELL PILL @2730STK
07:00 -0800 1.00 CIRC 1 LET POLLY PILL SET UPA5 MIN. MONITORING BACK SIDE WITH TRIP TANK
08:00 -08:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE&TRANSFER MUD FROMPREMIX TOACTIVE BRING LCM UPTO

Printed: 11/7/2007 7:32:26
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number 111

Date From - To Hours Code Descaption of Operabons

10/23/2007 08:00 -08:30 0.50 CIRC 1 25%
08:30 - 12:00 3.50 CIRC 6 FILL TRIP TANK CIRC. OVER THETOP TO MONITOR WELL WHILE BUILDING

VOLUME FILL DRILL PIPE
12:00 -14:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC&COND.LOSTAPPROX. 80BBLS DURINGCIRICUI.ATION
14:00-15:30 1.50 CIRC 6 CIRCACROSSTOPWHILEBUILDINGVOLUME-BUILD200BBLSPREMIX
15:30 - 18:00 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC &COND. LOST APPROX 66 BBLS
18:00 - 19:30 1.50 CIRC 6 CIRCULATE ACROSS THE TOP AND BUILD VOLUME IN PREMIX 200 BBLS
19:30-20:30 1.00 TRP 3 TRIP0UTUD6JNTS4"
2030 -22:00 1.50 CIRC 6 CIRCULAT ACROSS TOP AND BUILDVOLUME
22:00 - 02:00 4.00 CIRC 1 CIRC &COND. LOST APPRÓX. 51 BBLS
02:00 -05:00 3.00 CMT 3 R/UHALLIBURTON HOU)SAFETY IÆETING AND SOUEEZE CEMENT INTO

BTM FORMATION @13143
05:00-05:30 0.50 TRP 2 TRIPOUT3STANDS
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC OUT CEMENT IF ANY ABOVE THE BIT

10/24/2007 0600 - 08:30 2.50 WOT 1 CIRCULATE &CONDITION MUD &WAIT ON CEMENT
08:30 - 22:00 13.50 REAM 1 REAM FROM 12,330 TO 12,837 &DRILL CEMENT STRINGERS
2200 -00;00 2.00 CIRC 1 CONDITION MUD &CIRULATE (HOLE HEAVING 1/2 TO i" CUTTING@ 12,837

TO 12,804
0 .00

-06:00 6.00 REAM 1 WASH &REAM F/12837- 13129 &DRILL CEMENT STRINGERS
10/25/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 REAM 1 WASH &REAM 13,129' TO 13142' - COULD NOT MAKE BIT DRILL @13,142'

1030-12:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.&CONDITIONMUDFORTRIP
12:00 -13:30 1.60 TRP 10 TOH 20STANDS TO11,10Œ -HOLE BALLONING GMNG BACK MUD TOTAL 50

BBL
13:30 - 15:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. BOTTOMS UP & SPOT 40 BBL. 16.2 PPG PILL AT 11,100' - WELL TOOK

BACK 35 BBL. MUD WHILE CIRC.(BALLONING)
15:00 - 18:00 3.00 TRP 10 TOH TO SHOE MONITORING ON TRIP TANK- WELL FLOWED BACK35 BBL -

AT 9500' WELL STOPPED FLOWING
18:00-19:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC.BOTTOMSUPA7860D'
1200 - 03:30 8.50 TRP 10 TOH - AT 730f HOLE STARTFD TAKING CORRECT FILLUP
03:30-06:00 2.50 TRP 10 CHANGEBITS-TlHIFUNCTIONALLBOPCOMPONENTS

10/2&2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 TRP 10 TIH - CIRC @300f - 60DŒ - DROPPED DRILL STRING FROMSNAG ON SLIPS -

DROPPED 65STANDS + 1 SINGLE D.P &BHA
TOTAL LENGTH 7628.31'

10:00 - 16:30 6.50 FISH 5 TlHOPEN ENDED D.P. & TAG TÓP OF FISH @5480.30'
16:30 -20:00 3.50 CIRC 1 PLCK UPS ABOVE FISH TOP - CIRC. &CONDiTlON MUD TO 14.6 MUD WT.

IN/OUT
2 .00

-20:30 0.50 FISH $ SCREW INTO FISH & ESTABLISH CIRC.
2 30 - 21;30 1.00 FISH 3 CIRC. OUT GAS - MAX4& I¯LARE

21:30 - 03:30 6.00 FISH 3 JARRING UP ON FISH MAX 95K OVERPULL - STRING WT. 205,000 - MAX300K
PULL - JARS HITTING GOOD &FULL CIRC. WITHNO MUD LOSSES -JARRING
UPWITH 50K OVER

03:30 -06:00 2.50 FISH 3 CALLED SLAUGH FISHINGSERVICES & CONTINUE JARRINGON STUCK PIPE
WHILE WAITING ON FREEPOINT & FlSHING TOOLS

10/27/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 FISH 3 JARRING STUCK DRILL STRING &WAIT ON FREE POINT TO ARRIVE - ONLY
AVAILABLE PIPE RECOVERY WFD COMES FROMRÓCKSPRINGS

11:00 - 14:30 3.50 FISH 4 RIUWFD WIRELINE FREE POINTTOOLS -RAN FREE POINT &TOOLS WOULD
NOT PASS THROUGH SECOND JT. HWDP @11,950'

14:30- 18:00 3.50 FISH 4 RAN BACKOFF STRINGSROT &TAGGED UP @ 12,921' - THIS IS 1T INTO
SECOND DRILL COLLAR - PICKFD UPINTO CONNECTION BETWEEN TOP 2
DCs &ATTEMPTED BACK OFF WITH STRING SH0T (400 GRAIN CHARGE) NO
SUCCESS - PULL W.L. OUT OF PIPE & FOUND WIRE UNE HAD PUtl.ED OUT
OF RÒPE SOCKET & LEFT ROPE SOCKET AND SINKER BAR INSIDE DCs.

18:00 -19:00 1.00 FISH 4 RETIE HEAD &ROPE SOCKET -WAIT ON W.L FISHING TOOLS TO ARRIVE

Printett 11/7/2007 7:3226
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 GT-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Locatiort 31- &S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number 111

Date From - To Hours Code Descnption of Operations

10/27/2007 1900 - 20:30 1.50 FlSH 4 P/UWFD WIRE UNE FISHING TOOLS - MADE RUN WITH O.S. &SPANG JARS -

DID NOT CATCH FISH
20 30 - 22:00 1.50 FISH 4 ATTEMPT BACK OFF WITHSTRINGSHOT @12,827' - NOSUCCESS- DID NOT

BACK OFF
22:00 - 00:30 2.50 I¯lSH 4 WAIT ON FREE POINT TOOL TOARRIVE LOCATION
00:30 - 02:30 2.00 FISH 4 RAN FREE POINT & FOUND PIPE FREE @12,796'
02:30-03:00 0.50 FISH 4 RIGUPSTRINGSHOT
03:00 -05:00 2.00 FISH 4 RAN STRINGSHOT &MADE SUCCESSFUL BACK OFF @12,774' - 3RD JT.

HWDP ABOVE DRILL COLLARS
05:00-06:00 1.00 ClRC 1 CIRC.OUTABOVEFISH

10/28/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.OUT GAS FROM ABÓVE FISH &CÖNDITlÓN MUD 14.6 PPG IN &OUT -

MAX25' FLARE - CONDITl0N MUD14.6 PPG. IN &OUT
FISHLEFTINHOLEBIT-BITSUB-9EA.5"DCs-XOVER-3JTS.41/214#XT
39 HWDP - TOPOF FISH IN HOLE 12,774' - STRING SHOT TOOLS LEFT
INSIDE FISH I ROPE SOCKET - SINKER BAR - CCL - CONTACT SUB - SHOT
ROD 28' LENGTH

10:30 - 13:30 3.00 TRP 4 TÓH WITH FISH TO10,000
13:30 - 17:00 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.& CONDITION OUT OF BALANCE MUD &PUMP SLUG
17:00 -.03:00 10.00 TRP 4 TOH WFTHFISH SLOWLY TO PREVENT SWABBING - L/D 1 JT. BENT D.P. - L/D

2 JTS FROM FISH CONN.- L/D BOTTOM JT. HWDP - INSPECTED ALLHWDP &
NOBAD CONNS.FOUND

03:00 - 08:00 3.00 TRP 1 MAKE UP SLAUGHS FISHING TOOLS -SIS - CIRC. SUB -BUMP SUB -JAR -9
(4 3/4") DCs - INTENSIFIER - XOVER - TlH

10/29/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50 FISH 5 TIHWITH FISHING TOOLS - RETORQUE FA D.P. CONNECTION
13:30 - 16:00 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.& CONDITION MUD AT SHOE 8709
16:00 - 19:00 3.00 TRP 2 TIH &TAG FISH @ 12,T/4' W.L MEASUREMENT
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. OUT GAS &CONDITION MUD - MAX25' FLARE
20:30 - 06:00 9.50 FISH 3 SCREW INTO FISH AND I STABLISH CIRC.- JARRING ON FISH

STRING WT. 195 K- JAR UP 285 K- MAX300K PULL
TOP FISH 12,774' WFD W.L.IÆASUREMENT
12,764' DRILLERS PIPE IÆASUREMENT

10/3Œ2007 06:00-06:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.PUMP16.2DRYSLUG
06:30 -09:00 2.50 FISH 4 SET BACK KELLY & MAKE GAUGE RUN WITH WFD W.L SINKER BAR 17/16' -

TAG UPAT12,913'
OEt00 - 11:00 2.00 FISH 4 RUN IN HOLE WITH FREE POINT TOOL
11:00 -13:00 2.00 FISH 4 RUNIN HOLE WFTHSTRING SHOT.BACKED OFF WIRE LINE

IÆASUREMENTS @1279¾.RIGDOWN WIRE LINE CREW
13:00 -01:00 12.00 TRP 2 TOOH WITH FISHING TOOLS.LEFT SLAUGH SCREW IN SUB IN HOLE. 3'.36'

LONG,3 JTS. HWDP, XO, 9 DRILL COLLARS, XO,Bir. TOP OF FISH @1276f
(SLM).

01:00 -06:00 5.00 MELDPRE JOB SAFETY MEETING. MAKE UP BIT, WEATHERFORD FUIJ..
GAUGE STRING REAMERS AND BHA.
TIH GAUGE RUN BEFORE RUNNINGWHIP STOCK

10/31/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 TRP 15 TIH WITH 61/8" TRI CONE &WATERMELON MILLS FOR GAUGE RUN PRIOR
TO LOGGING & RUNNING WHIPSTOCK.

08:00-11:00 3.00 CIRC 1 CIRC.&CONDITIONMUDATSHOE870Œ
11:00-12:30 1.50 RIG 6 CUTDRILLLINE
12:30 -13:00 0.50 TRP 15 TlHIGAUGE RUN-TAG UP@ 9313'
13:00-16:00 3.00 CIRC 1 CIRC.ANDCONDITION
16;00 -16:30 0.50 CIRC 1 BUILD & PUMP SLUG
16:30 -19:30 3.00 TRP 3 UD 30JTS D.P FOR REAMING &RAN 10STANDS IN FROM DERRICK
19:30-06:00 10.50 REAM i REAMFROM9313'TO9484'

HARD REAMING - SLOUGHING SHALE

Pinted: 11/7/2007 7:32:25
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24--E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number 111

Date From -To Hours Code C Descnption of Operations

11/1/2007 06:00 -13:30 7.50 REAM 1 WASH&REAM FROM9464' TO952T
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 RIG 4 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
14:00 -14:30 0.50 OTH BUILD AND PUMP PILL
14:30 - 00:00 9.50 TRP 10 TOOH,LAY DOWN FULL GAUGE BHA, REAMERS AND BIT LOOK GOOD. BIT IN

GAUGE, REAMERS 1/32 OUT
00'00 - 03:00 3.00 TRP 10 MAKE UP NEW BHA, TIH WITH BIT #10 TO2972'
03:00 -03:30 0.50 CIRC 1 BREAK CIRCULATION
03:30 -06'00 2.50 TRP 10 TIH

11/212007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 TRP 2 TIH to esg. shoe @880Œ
07:00 -10:30 3.50 CIRC 1 Filipipe, circulate
10:30 - 12 00 1.50 TRP 2 TIH toS464'
12:00 -15:00 3.00 REAM 1 Wash &Ream F/9464' -9868'

15:00 - 15:30 0.50 TRP 2 TIH io 10199
15'30 - 16:30 1.00 REAM 1 Wash &Ream Fl 1019& - 10290
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RIG 1 Lubricate rig
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 REAM 1 Wash &Ream Fl 1029& - 10327
17:30 - 19:00 1.50 TRP 2 TIH to 12214'
19:00 -04:30 9.50 REAM 1 Wash &Ream F/12214' -12,798 - DRILLERS MEASUREMENTS

TOP OF FISH 12,798
043D-06:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.&CONDITIONMUD

11/3/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.&CONDITlÓN MUD - SLUG PIPE & DROP SURVEY
12:30 -17:30 5.00 TRP 2 TOH TO SHOE - SLM
17:30 -18:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
18:00 - 01:30 7.50 TRP 2 FINISH TOH FOR LOGS - SLM
01:30 - 02:30 1.00 LOG 1 SAFETY MEETING& RIG UP HALLIBURTON LOGGERS
02:30 -06:00 3.50 LOG 1 RAN GRINEUIRES. INDUCTlON LOG - HOWCOTAGGED UP@ 12,749

SLM TOP FISH 12,760.92

EXTENSION FOR BOP 30DAY TEST GRANTED FOR 4 DAYS EMAIL FROM JIM
ASHLEYBLM

11/4/2007 06:0D -08:00 2.00 LOG 1 FINISH OPEN HOLE LOGGING, LOGGERS TD @1274&,DRILL PIPE STRAP
12761'

08:00 - 08:30 0.50 RIG 2 RIG SERVICE, CRÓWN AND BLOCKS , ETC.
08:30 -10:00 1.50 WOT 4 WAIT ON REAMERS, RIGGING UPSTEAM UNES, CONDITIONING MUD
10:00 - 11:30 1.50 TRP 1 MAKEUP BHA, UNDERGAUGE REAMERS FOR WHIPSTOCK
11:30 - 12:30 1.00 TRP 15 TIH WITH REAMERS
12:30-15:00 2.50 TRP 2 TOOHTOPICKUPWEATHERFORDWHIPSTOCKTOOL
15:00 -18:00 3.00 TRP 15 MAKE UP BIT, AND SLICK ASSEMBLY, GAS BUBBLING ABOVE ROTARY

TABLE, TlH TO 390Œ
18:00 -19:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND CONDITION MUD TO14.8 PPG
1900-20:00 1.00 TRP 15 TIHTO6182'
2000-21:30 1.50 TRP 15 CIRCULATEGASOUTANDCONDITIONMl.lDTO14.8PPG
21:30 - 23:00 1.50 TRP 15 PUMP 20 BBL PILLAND TlH TO 8715'
2300 - 00:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND CONDITION MUD TO 14.8 PPG
00 30 - 01:30 1.00 TRP 15 PUMP 20 BBL PILLAND TlH TO 10463'
01:30 - 03:30 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND CONDITION MUD TO 14.5+
03;30 - 04 30 1.00 TRP 15 TIH TO 12,40Œ
04:30-06:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.OUTGAS*CONDITIONMUD

11/5/2007 06:00-07:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC.&CONDITIONMUDTO14.81NIOUT@12,400'
07:00 - 08:30 1.50 TRP 2 SLUG & LD. 12 JTS. D.P.
08:30 -09:00 0.50 TRP 2 RAN LAST 4STANDS D.P. IN HOLE FROM DERRICK
0900-11:30 2.50 REAM 1 REAMFROM12,450'TO12,657

Printed: 11/7/2007 7:32:26
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Operations Summary Report

WellName: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-1 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code C Descnplion of Operations

11/5/2007 11:30 - 13:30 2.00 CIRC 2 HOLE TAKINGMUD WITH 14.8 /14.9 MUD WT. - PUMP LCM SWEEPS &
LOWER MUD WT. TO14.7 -LOST 260 BBL. MUD TOTAL BEFORE LOSSES
STABAL1ZED

13:30 - 16:00 2.50 REAM 1 REAMED FROM 12,657 TO TOP OF FISH 12,762'
16:00 -21:00 5.00 CIRC 1 CIRC.& CONDITION FOR CEMENT PLUG, WAIT ON HAIJJBURTON
21:00-0000 3.00 CIRC 1 RIGUPHAU.lBURTON, HOLEPREJOBSAFETYMEETING,CIRCULATE
00:00 - 02:00 2.00 CMT 4 TEST UNES TO 1500 PSI. SET 150 SX BALANCE PLUG. 17.5 PPG, .94 YlELD,

3.33 GAUSK, ESTIMATED TOP ÓF CEMENT @12067,
0200 -03:00 1.00 TRP 2 TOOH TO11924
03:00 - 04:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITON HOLE
04 00 - 06:00 2.00 TRP 2 TOOH

11/6/2007 06:0D - 07:30 1.50 TRP 2 TOOH - SPOT 40 BBL. 16.2 @10,000' & 870f - HOLE BALLONING
HOLE STOPPED BAU..ONING @7000 & STARTED TAKING CORRECT FILLUP

NOTIFIED BLM CUFF JOHNSON OF UPCOMNG BOP TEST BYTELEPHONE
07:30 -08:30 1.00 CIRC 1 BUILD 40 BBL 16.2 SLUG AND PUMP
08:30 -09:30 1.00 TRP 2 TOOH TO8700
0930 -10:30 1.00 CIRC 1 BUILD 40 BBL 16.2 SLUG AND PUMP
1030 - 17:30 7.00 TRP 2 TOOH
17:30 - 22:00 4.50 BOP 2 TEST BOP AND ALL VALVES AND UNES, CH0KE MANIFOLD TO 250 PSI LOW

AND 10000 PSI HIGH (OK). TEST HYDRILL TO 250 PSI LOW AND 5000 PSI
HIGH (OK).

22:00 - 22:30 0.50 BOP 2 RIG DOWN BOP TESTER
22;30 -01:00 2.50 TRP 2 T1HWITH SLICK DRILLING ASSEMBLY to3005'
01:00 - 01:30 0.50 CIRC 1 FILL PIPE
01:30 - 03:00 1.50 TRP 2 TlH TO 6019
03:00 - 03:30 0.50 CIRC 1 FILL PIPE
03:30 - 05:00 1.50 TRP 2 TlH TO SHOE
0500-06:00 1.00 RIG 6 CUTDRILLLINE

11/7/2007 06:00-07:00 1.00 RIG 6 SLIP&CUTDRILLIJNE-CIRC.ATB750 WHILECUTTINGLINE
07:00-09:00 2.00 TRP 2 TIHTO1100D'
0900 -11:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATEBOTTOMS UP
11:30 - 13:30 2.00 TRP 2 TOOH 27 JTS LAYlNG DOWN PIPE
13:30-14:30 1.00 TRP 2 TlHLASTSTANDSFROMDERRICKTO1087f-DERRICKCLEANEDUP
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 TRP 2 WASH & REAM F/ 1087& - 1091&
15:00-15:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
15:30 - 17:30 2.00 DRL 4 DRILLED CEMENT FROM 12,03T TO 12,052' - @12052' 12K WOB AND

CEMENT WOULD NOT DRILL OFF - PLUG BACK IS HARD & SOLID
17;30 -19:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATEBOTTOMS UPAND BUILD PII.L
19:00 - 06:00 11.00 TRP 2 PUMPED PILL TO DRY PIPE FOR TRIP - BIT PLUGGED, TOOH WITH WET

DRILL STRING, SLM - TRIED THREE TIMES TO UNPLUG STRING WITH NO
SUCCESS.

Prhited 11/7/2007 7:32:28
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-5 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code S Description of Operations

8/30/2007 06:00-00:00 18.00 LOC 3 MIRU
00:00 -05 00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILLED 0 / 1190'
05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 10 BIT TRIP

8/31/2007 06:00 - 20:30 14.50 DRL 1 DRILL 1190° l 1820' - WATER FLOW @ 1630'
20:30 - 01:30 5.00 TRP 10 BIT TRIP
01:30 - 06:00 4.50 DRILL 1820' / 1990°

9/1/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL1990' I 2260'
13:00-14:00 1.00 TRP 3 L,D.D.P.
14:00 - 16:30 2.50 CSG 2 RAN 2210'9 5/8" 36# CASING
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 CMT 2 CEMENT CASING 760 SKS. CLASS G
17:00 -06:00 13.00 LOC 8 RID & RELEASE RIG

9/11/2007 06:00 -19:00 13.00 LOC 3 MOVEIN RIG 90% MOVED IN - SET MAT BOARDS / SUB BASE / INSTAL
SPREADER BEAMS ON SUB

NOTIFIED CLIFF JOHNSON BLM OF MOVING QN LOCATION
19:00 - 06:00 11.00 LOC 4 RIG IDLE WAIT ON DAYLIGHT

9/12/2007 08:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIU R1G 35% - REPAIR DWKS BRAKES& DRUM - BREAK DOWN DERRICK
FOR INSPECTION -TRUCKS RELEASED @1700 HR.

18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG IDLEWAITING ON DAYLIGHT
9/13/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12 00 LOC 4 RIGUP 45%-SANDBLASTPINPOCKETSON DERRICK,A-LEGS.DERRICK

SHOES, DEAD-MAN ACHOR,CROWN AND CRAZE WHEEL. MAGNA FLUX
SAME.-CHANGED OUT BREAK FLANGES ON DWKS. CHANGED RADIATOR
ON #2 PUMP MOTOR ANDWORK ON ACHORS FOR NEW FLARE LINES

18:00 -06:00 12.00 LOC 4 RIG 1DLEWAIT ON DAYLIGHT
9/14/2007 06:00 - 18:00 1200 LOC 4 RIG UP - PUT DWKSBACK TOGETHER,PRIMER AND PAINT SPOT ON

DERRICK T½AT WASCHECKED, HELP WELDERS BUILD FLARE LINE ACHORS
AND PUT FLARE LINE TOGETHER.

9/15/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12 00 LOC 4 RIG UP - 70% - PUT DERR(CK BACK TOGETHER AFTER INSPECTIONAND
FINISH SETTING RIG IN - FLARE BOX AND BAR HOPPERS

18:00 -06:00 1200 LOC 4 RIG IDLE - WAIT ON DAYLIGHT
9/16/2007 06:00 -06:00 24 00 LOC 4 RIG UP -100%- STRING UP BLOCKS, PREPARE DERRICK TO RAISE,BURN IN

NEW BREAKPADS, RAISE DERRICK, RIG UP FLOOR AND ROTARY TOOLS,
KELLYAND SWIVELAND FINIISH UP WITH FLARE LINES AND ANCHORS

9/17/2007 06:00 -10:00 4 00 WHO 1 CUT OFF CASINGAND CONDUCTOR AND WELDON 9 5/8 WELL HEAD AND
TEST TO 1000 PSI

10:00 -11:00 1 00 WHD 1 LET WELL HEAD COOL DOWN
11:00 -00 30 13 50 BOP 1 NIPPLE UP SM BOPS, NIPPLE UP BOTH SIDESMANUALVALVES, CHOKE

HOSE &WELD FLOW TO FIT ROTATING HEAD.
00:30 - 01:30 1.00 BOP 1 TORQUEUP KELLY Fl TESTING
01:30 -06:00 4.50 BOP 2 TEST 80PS- TEST KELLYVALVESLOW(250 PSI) 5 MIN HIGH (5000 PSl} 10

MIN- FLOOR VALVES, PIPE RAMS, BLIND RAMS, MANUALVALVES, HCR, AND
CHOKE MANIFOLD, (250 PSI) LOW 5 MIN (5000 PSI) HIGH 10 MIN.- ANNULAR
(250 PSI) LOW 5 MIN (3500 PSI )HIGH 10 MIN

9/18/2007 06:00 -07:00 1 00 EOT 1 PUMP UP AND TEST CASING(1500 PSI )15 MIN
07:00 -08:00 1 00 BOP 1 INSTALLWEAR BUSHING
08:00 -11:00 3 00 STRAPBHAAND CLEAN UP SUB AND FLOOR AFTER NIPPLEUP AND TEST
11:00 -16:00 5 00 RIG 2 REPAIR DWKS BRAKES WOULD NOT MOVE BLOCKS WITHOUT REVERSE

BLOCK DOWN.ADJUSTED AND AND CHANGE THE SPRINGPLACEMENT.
16:00 - 16:30 0 50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 22:00 5,50 TRP 1 PICK UP 8 3/4- 504 ZX, SQUARE MOTOR, BHA AND 4 1/2 DP.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 LEVEL DERRICK
22:30 -01:30 3,00 TRP 3 CONTINUE PICKING UP 4 1/2 DP
01:30 -04:00 2.50 RIG 2 RIGREPAIR-WORK ON CATHEAD MAKEUP SIDE THE CHAINWILL SUCKIN

Printed: 12/3/2007 10:31 01 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

9/18/2007 01:30 -04:00 2.50 RIG 2 THE CATHEAD AT A FAST RATE OF SPEED WITH OUT USINGTHE LEVER
SHUT DOWN TO FIX ALLSO THE KELLY SPINNERS NOT WORKING. GOT
KELLY SPINNERS WORKING

04:00 -05:00 1.00 LEVEL DERRICK
05:00 -06:00 1.00 BOP 1 INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER AND OILER LINES

9/19/2007 06:00 -06:30 0.50 TEST PUMPS & R/U WIRE LINE MACHINE
06:30 -07:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
07:00 -10:00 3.00 DRL 1 TAGUP CEMENT @2165 DRLGCEMENT Fl 21650-2260- FLOAT COLLAR @

2181 & SHOE @2225
10:00 -11:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 2260 -2273- PUMP SWEEP
11:00 - 11:30 0.50 EQT 2 FIT TEST - F/11.6 PPG - WI 8.3 PPG- PUMPED UP 400 PSI BLED BACK TO 377

PSI IN 15MIN.- MUD EQUIV. TO 11.46 PPG
11:30 -12:00 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY- @2194 INC. 3.0
12:00 -17:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRLG FI 2273-2425
17:00 -17:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY- @2360 INC. 3.2
17:30 - 05:00 11.50 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 2425- 2867
05:00 -05:30 0.50 SUR 1 WIRE LINE SURVEY- @2797
05:30 -06:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/2867-2898

9/20/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 2898 - 3054
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 DRL 1 WORK ON PUMPS
10:30 -11:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 3054 -3086
11:00 - 11:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE - CHANGE OUT AIR MOTOR Fl AUTO DRILLER AND PUMP UP

WT. INDACATOR.
11:30 - 16:00 4.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ DRLG FI 3086 - 3366
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC& SURVEY @3251 INC. 2.2
17:00 -01:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 3366-3926
01:30 -02:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @3856 2.3
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 3926-4130

9/21/2007 06:00 -11:30 5 50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 4130-4425
11:30 -12:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY- @4349 2.0 INC
12:30-15:30 3.00 DRL 1 DRLGF/4425-4642
15:30 -16:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:00 - 21:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 4642- 4922
21:00 - 22:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC. & SURVEY @4852
22:00 -06:00 8.00 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 4922- 5310

9/22/2007 06:00-08:30 2.50 DRL 1 DRLGFl5310-5420
08:30 -09:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @5344 INC 2.7
09:30 - 16:00 6.50 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 5420 - 5605
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 04:30 12.00 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 5605-5944
04:30 -05:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @5874 MISRUN
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLG FI 5944-5954

9/23/2007 06:00 -06:30 0.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 5954-5976
06:30 -07:30 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @5900 INC. 2.5
07:30 - 16:00 8.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 5976- 6282
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 22:00 5.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 6282- 6468
22:00 - 23:00 1.00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @6399 2.6
23:00-06:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRLGFl6468-6568

9/24/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 6658-6830- MOTOR PRESSURED UP
13:30 -14:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC. BTM UP
14:30 -16:00 1.50 TRP 13 TRIP OUT MOTOR STARTED TO PRESSURE UP
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 FLOW CHECK- THE TRIP TANK NOT WORK RIGHT PASON PROBLEM-

Printed: 12/3/2007 10 31 01
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Description of Operations

9/24/2007 16:00 - 16:30 0.50 STRAPED TANK TO KEEP TRACK - FLOW WENT FROM 3/4" FLOW TO
NOTHING,ITHINK JUST FLOW LINE DRIANING BECAUSE IT QUIT FAST.

16:30 -20:30 4.00 TRP 13 FINISH TRIPPING OUT OF HOLE- HOLE TOOK 23 BBLS OVER CALCULATIONS
20:30 -22:30 2.00 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT MOTOR & BIT- WENT FI SQUARE .25 TO A HUNTING.15

22:30 -00:30 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN TO SHOE
00:30 -01:00 0.50 CIRC 1 INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER & BREAK CIRC.
01:00 -03:30 2.50 TRP 2 FINISH TRIP IN HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE
03:30 -04:30 1.00 REAM 1 SAFETY REAM F/6789-6830
04:30 -06:00 1.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 6830-6870

9/25/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5 00 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 6870-6973
11:00 - 12:00 1 00 SUR 1 CIRC & SURVEY @6890- INC 3.0
12:00 - 15:00 3 00 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 6973-7065
15:00 - 15:30 0 50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30 -03:00 11 50 DRL 1 DRLG FI7065-7345
03:00 -04:00 1 00 SUR 1 CIRC. & SURVEY @7269-INC 2.8
04:00 -06:00 2 00 DRL 1 DRLG F/7345-7392

9/26/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10 00 DRL 1 DRLG F / 7392-7622
16:00 -16:30 0 50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 04:00 11 50 DRL 1 DRLG F/7622- 7777 - LAST 10 HRS AVG. 12.4 FT HR
04:00 -05:00 1 00 CIRC 1 CIRC BTM'S UP
05:00 -06:00 1 00 SUR 1 DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL

9/27/2007 06:00 -10:30 4 50 TRP 10 TOH CHANGE BITS
10:30 - 16:30 6 00 TRP 10 TIH BIT # 3 504 ZX
16:30 -17:00 0 50 REAM 1 WASH 60' TO BOTTOM AS PRECAUTION
17:00 -06:00 1300 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 7777' TO 7990'

9/28/2007 06:00 -15:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 7990' TO 8211'
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 - 23:30 7.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8211' TO 8300°- ROP DROPPED OFF TO 6' HR.
23:30 -01:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & CONDITION MUD FOR BIT TRIP
01:00 - 06:00 5.00 TRP 10 TOH WITH BIT #3

9/29/2007 06:00 -09:00 3.00 TRP 10 FINISHED TOH CHANGE BITS & MUD MOTOR (HUNTING 0.15)
09:00 - 10:00 1.00 TRP 10 TIH TO 2200'
10:00 -11:30 1.50 RIG 6 CUT DRILL LINE
11:30 -14:00 2.50 TRP 10 TlH BIT # 4
14:00 -14:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM 60' TO BOTTOM - PRECAUTION
14:30 -15:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8300' TO 8303'
15:00 -15:30 0.50 RtG 1 SER RIG
15:30 -03:30 12.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8303' TO 8457'
03:30 -04:00 0.50 RIG 2 REPAIR LINE GUIDE
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8457' TO 8492'

9/30/2007 06:00 - 15:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8492 TO 8643'
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 -06:00 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8643' TO 8762'

10/1/2007 06:00 -11:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8762' TO 8800'

NOTIFIED BLM (CLIFF JOHNSON VOICE MAIL0 OF UPCOMING CASING &
CEMENTJOB

11:00 -12:00 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP HI VIS SWEEP & CIRC. AROUND
12:00 - 13:00 1.00 TRP 14 10 STAND WIPER TRIP - HOLE SLICK
13:00 -15:00 2.00 CIRC 1 PUMP HI VIS SWEEP & CIRC. OUT
15:00 -21:00 6.00 TRP 2 TOH - SLM -L/D M.M. - MONEL - 2 STBS.
21:00 - 22:00 1.00 LOG 1 SAFETY MEETING &RIG UP LOGGING ADAPTOR & HOWCO LOGGING TOOLS
22:00 -02:00 4.00 LOG 1 RAN TRIPLE COMBO FROM 8800' TO 2262'

Printed: 12/3/2007 10:31 01
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Description of Operations

10/1/2007 02:00 -03:00 1.00 LOG 1 R/D HOWCO LOGGING TOOLS
03:00 -06:00 3.00 TRP 15 TIH WITH TRICONE BIT & SLICK BHA

10/2/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 TRP 15 TIH TRICONE BIT SLICK BHA
07:30 -09:00 1.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM 120' TO BOTTOM AS PRECAUTION - NO FILL
09:00 -10:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC. BOTTOMS UP
10:00 -10:30 0.50 TRP 3 SAFETY MEETING - R/U L/D TRUCK
10:30 -15:00 4.50 TRP 3 L.D.D.P. 4 1/2"
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 RIG 2 REPAIR BREAK OUT LINE
16:00 - 20:30 4.50 TRP 3 L.D.D.P.
20:30 -21:00 0.50 OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
21:00 -00:00 3.00 CSG 1 R/U ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING TOOLS
00:00 - 06:00 6.00 CSG 2 RAN 7" -26# - P-110 CASING

10/3/2007 06:00 -06:30 0 50 CIRC 1 CIRC. CASING @5000'
06:30 -11:30 5 00 CSG 2 RAN 7" 26# P-110 LT&C CASING TOTAL 192 JTS
11:30 - 14:00 2 50 CIRC 1 CASING STACKED OUT @8754 - CIRC. AND CONDITION MUD TO 11.2 IN

11.2OUT -HEAVY PACKING OFF TRYING TO GET PAST 8754 - LARGE
AMOUNT OF HEAVING SHALE OVER SHAKERS - AFTER 2 HRS. SHALE
CLEARED UP BUT CONTINUE PACKING OFF BELOW 8754'

SHOE @8800'- FLOAT @8753'
14:00 - 16:00 2 00 CMT 1 RIGUP HOWCOCEMENTERS- CIRC WHILE RIGGINGUP CEMENTERS -

SAFETY MEETING
16:00 -20:00 4 00 CMT 2 CEMENT WITH 300 SK. 11 # HI FILL YLD 3.84 LEAD SLURRY -950 SK. 14.3

YLD. 1.24 POZ PREM TAIL - DISPLACED Wl334 BBL. 11.2 MUD - NOCEMENT
TO SURFACE - BUMP PLUG 3000 PSI. - FLOATS HELD

20:00 - 20:30 0 50 CMT 1 RIG DOWN HOWCO CEMENTERS
20:30 - 23:30 300 BOP 1 UNBOLT BOP STACK
23:30 - 01:30 2 00 CSG 7 LIFT STACK - SET CSG. SLIPS WITH 200K WT. ON SLIPS - ROUGH CUT

CASING
01:30 -05:00 3.50 BOP 1 NIPPLE DOWN & LAYOUT BOPS
05:00 -06:00 1.00 WHD 1 DRESS CASING STUB & NIPPLE UP B SECTION

DRESS T CASING STUB - NIPPLE UP B SECTION

NOTIFIED BLM CLIFF JOHNSON VOICE MAILOF CASING & CEMENT JOB AND
GAVE NOTICE ON TESTING BOPS @0430 HRS. 10/03/2007

10/4/2007 06:00 -06:30 0.50 WHD 1 NIPPLE UP 7 1/16 10K X 11" 5K B SECTION
TEST 5K

06:30 - 14:30 8.00 BOP 1 N/U BOP & PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT & P/U KELLY
14:30 - 20:30 6.00 BOP 2 TEST BOP BLINDIPIPE RAMS 250/10K - CHOKE & KILLMANIFOLD HCR VALVE

AND ALL GATE VALVES 250/10K - TIW KELLYCOCKS & IBOP 250/10K -

HYDRIL 250/5000 - EA. TEST 10 MIN. CHARTED BY B&C TESTERS - TEST
CASING 1500 PSI. 30 MIN.
KOOMY FUNCTION & PRECHARGE

20:30 - 23:30 3.00 BOP 1 NIPPLE UP ROTATING HEAD & ATTEMPT TO HOOK UP FLOW LINE - WOULD
NOT LINE UP - CALLED WELDER

23:30 -02:30 3.00 OTH LAY OUT & STRAP SLIM HOLE BHA & 4" D.P.
CHANGE LINERS SWABS IN MUD PUMPS FROM 6" TO 5"
R/U LAY DOWN TRUCK

02:30 -05:00 2.50 BOP 1 WELDER REFAB & FINISH HOOK UP FLOW LINE
05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 1 P/U SLIM HOLE BHA

10/5/2007 06:00 -13:00 7.00 TRP 1 P/U SLIM HOLE DRILL STRING tih to 4000'
13:00 - 16:00 3.00 TRP 2 DRILL STRING PLUGGED - TOH WET PIPE - FOUND FLOAT IN TOP OF MUD

MOTOR UPSIDE DOWN
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Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111
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10/5/2007 16:00 -18:30 2.50 TRP 2 TIH TO 4000' & FILL PIPE
18:30 -19:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.
19:00 - 23:30 4.50 TRP 1 P/U 4" D.P.
23:30 -00:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. @8078°

00:00 -01:00 1.00 TRP 1 P/U 4" D.P. TAG OUT @8623'
01:00 -01:30 0.50 OTH R/D LAY DOWN TRUCK
01:30 -05:00 3.50 DRL 4 DRILL CEMENT FROM 86433' -8800 + 10' NEW HOLE'
05:00 - 05:30 0.50 EQT 2 FIT -13.59 EMW
05:30 -06:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8800 TO 8842'

10/6/2007 06:00 - 15:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 8842' TO 9332'
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 -06:00 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 9332' TO 10,137'

10/7/2007 06:00 - 16:30 10.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 10,137' TO 10,498'
16:30 -17:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
17:00 -06:00 13.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 10,498' TO 10,950'

10/8/2007 06:00 -13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 10,950' TO 11,210' -RAISING MUD WT. TO 12.9
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & FINISH RAISING MUD WT. TO 12.9
13:30 -15:30 2.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 11,210' TO 11,295'
15:30 - 17:30 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC. OUT GAS FROM 20 BBL. PIT GAIN & RAISE MUD WT. TO 13.3
17:30 - 20:00 2.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 11,295' TO 11,438'- RAISING MUD WT. TO 13.4
20:00 - 23:00 3.00 OTH CIRC. WITH 13.4 MUD WT. & WAIT ON BARITE BULKTRUCKS
23:00 -02:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 11,438' TO 11,612'- MUD WT. 13.6
02:00 - CIRC 1 GAS BUBBLE TO SURFACE TOOK 40 BBL. PIT GAIN AND 60' FLARE - SHUT IN

AND CIRC.& CONDITION MUD WT. TO 13.9 GOING THRU THE CHOKE
10/9/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.OUT GASON CHOKE & BRING UP MUD WT. FROM 13.6 TO 13.9 -

FLARE 40'
07:30 - 15:30 8.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 11,612' TO 11,860°

15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 -06:00 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 11,860' TO 12,127'

10/10/2007 06:00 -15:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 12,127' TO 12,346'
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
16:00 -06:00 14.00 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 12,346' TO 12,630'

10/11/2007 06:00 -14:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 12,630' TO 12768
14:30 -17:00 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC & COND RAISE MUD WT TO 14.8PPG
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
17:30 - 19:30 2.00 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 12768 TO 12800
19:30 - 20:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM TIGHT CONNECTION
20:00 -23:30 3.50 CIRC 6 CIRC. & COND BUILD VOLUME LOST PARTIAL RETURNS APPROX. 150 BBL.

PUMP SWEEPS GOT ALL RETURNS BACK
23:30 -01:00 1.50 DRL 1 DRLF Fl 12800 TO 12819
01:00 -06:00 5.00 CIRC 6 CIRC.&COND. BUILD VOLUME LOST PARTIAL RETURNSAGAIN LOST

APPROX. 100 BBL MAINTANE MUD WT. 14.7 PPG. AIR BLOWER F/ BAR
HOPPER WENT DOWN HAD TO REPLACE OUT OF EVANSTON WYO. USE
SACK BAR WHILE WAITING

10/12/2007 06:00 - 12:00 6.00 CIRC 6 CIRC. & BUILD MUD VOLUME & WT. 14.6 PPG.- LOST APPROX. 150 BBLS.
12:00 -13:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 12819 TO 12833
13:30 -14:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
14:00 -03:30 13.50 DRL 1 DRLG FI 12833 TO 12931- PUMP LCM SWEEPSAFTER EACH CONN. AND

DURING AS NEED FOR SEEPAGE
03:30 -06:00 2.50 CIRC 6 CIRC. BUILD VOLUME PACK OFF & SEEPAGE BUILDVOLUME LOST APPROX.

140 BBLS
10/13/2007 06:00 -06:00 24.00 CIRC 6 CIRC.AND ATTEMPT TO RAISE MUD WT. TO 15PPGAND LOST MOST

RETURUNS AT A 14.6 PPG PUMP HIGH LCM SWEEPS AND WORKING ON

I
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Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

10/13/2007 06:00 -06:00 24.00 CIRC 6 RAISING THE ACTIVE TO 15% OR BETTER IN LCM. LOST APPROX. 480 BBLS
IN 24 HRS.HOLE ACTING OK.

10/14/2007 06:00 -08:30 2.50 CIRC 6 CIRC & COND. BUILD VOLUME MUD WT. 15 PPG, BUILD LCM CONTENT TO 20
%

08:30 -14:30 6.00 DRL 1 DLRG F/ 12931 TO 12954
14:30 -06:00 15.50 CIRC 6 CIRC& COND. BUILD VOLUME, RAISE MUD WT 15 PPG. BUIKLD LCM

CONTENT TO 20%
10/15/2007 06:00 -15:00 9.00 CIRC 6 CIRC. & COND.BRING LCM CONTENT TO 20% STABLIZE MUD WT. TO 14.8

USED 80 BBLS OF 15.5 MUD TO FEED IN SYSTEM
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 WCL 3 FLOW CHECK - FIRST 15 MIN 2.5 BBLS TO 1.4 BBLSMIN-SECOND 15 MIN 1.4

BBLS TO .77 BBLS MIN-THIRD 15 MIN. .77 BBLS STEADY.
16:00 -17:30 1.50 CIRC 6 CIRC. COND. - CIRC BTMS UP AFTER FLOW CHECK ANDMAINTAINMUD WT

14.8 PPG AND LCM CONTENT 20% BUILD VOLUME
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
18:00 -02:30 8.50 CIRC 1 CIRCAND COND. PLANS TO DOA 10 STD SHORT TRIPSPOTED A 16.8 PPG

PILL WOULD NOT HOLD STATICHAD 200 PSI ON STAND PIPE PUMPED IT
OUT. SPOTED ANOTHER 17.4 PPG

02:30 -04:00 1.50 TRP 14 SHORT TRIP 10 STDS-FLOWEFD BACK 82.3 BBLSDURINGTRIP
04:00 -06:00 2.00 CIRC 6 CIRC&BUILD VOLUME LOST APPROX. 200 BBLS CIRC HEAVY PILL OUT

10/16/2007 06:00 - 17:30 11.50 CIRC 1 CIRULATE OUT HEAVEY PILL &PUMP LCM SWEEPS&REGAIN CIRC. (LOST
APROX. 250 BBLS )

17:30 -18:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
18:00 -20:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & MAINTAINMUD WT. 14.6
20:30 -23:00 2.50 WCL 3 FLOW CHECK (WELL FLOWED 75 BBLS )
23:00 -02:30 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRC GAS OUT (800 STROKES RAW GAS, GAINED 39BBLS )
02:30 -06:00 3.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT TO THE SHOE

10/17/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 RIG 6 CUT DRLG LINE
07:00 -09:30 2.50 CIRC 1 WELL START TO FLOW ABOUT 3/4" STREAM,SOPICK UP KELLYSTARTED

CIRCULATING HAD A FLARE RIGHT AWAY 2/5' BTMS UP GAVE A 20/30' FLARE
BUILT A 1LLB OVER PILL 15.6 SPOT AT SHOE. STOPPED PUMPS FLOWED
BACK 12 BBLS.

09:30 - 11:00 1.50 TRP 2 STARTED TO TRIP OUT PULLED 7 STANDS SLOW AND ON EACH STAND
SWABBING .5 TO 1 BBL PER STAND PLUS CAP. OF THE STAND SO IT
AVERAGE OUT TO 2/2.5 BBLS A STAND. TRIP BACK TO SHOE

11:00 - 14:30 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRC OUT GAS AND RAISE MUD WT. BACK TO A 14.6 PPG AND MAINTAIN.
BUILD AND PUMP A 16.2 PILL 3BBLS SPOT AT THE SHOE.

14:30 - 16:30 2.00 TRP 2 FLOW CHECK-FLOWED BACK 50 BBLS IN 20 MIN. PULLED 7 STANDS
SWABBING .5 TO 1 BBL PER STAND BUT NOT CAP.

16:30 -19:30 3.00 CIRC 1 CIRC GAS OUT AND MAINTAIN14.6PPG MUD WT FLARES 0/20'
19:30 - 20:00 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN 10 STANDS F/ 8878 TO 10044
20:00 - 23:30 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRC&COND.- C1RCULATE GAS OUT AND COND. MUD MAINTAIN14.6 MUD

WT. FLARES 10/70'
23:30 -00:00 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN 10 STANDS F/ 10044 TO 11039
00:00 -02:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC & COND. - CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND COND. MUD MAINTAIN14.6 MUD

WT. FLARES 30/90'
02:30 -03:30 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN 10 STANDSFl 11039 TO 12038
03:30 -05:30 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC & COND. - CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND COND. MUD MAINTAIN14.6 MUD

WT. FLARES 15/90'
05:30 -06:00 0.50 TRP 2 FINISH TRIP IN 12954

10/18/2007 06:00 -15:30 9.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & CONDITION MUD ,MAINTAIN14.6 & BRING LCM BACK UP TO 20%
15:30 -16:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:00 - 19:00 3.00 CIRC 1 SPOT 70 BBL G-SEAL & POLLY SWELL@ 2979
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP 2PPG OVER FOR CAP &CONTROLL FLOW BACK ON DRILL STRING

Printed: 12/3/2007 10:31 01



Questar E & P Page 7 of 15

Operations Summary Report
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Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
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10/18/2007 20:00 - 23:00 3.00 TRP 10 PULL 19 STANDS & CIRC BTMS UP (30 TO 40' FLARE )@11,200
23:00 -00:00 1.00 CIRC 1 SPOT 16.2 MUD WT. @2450 STROKES & PUMP 1/2PPG OVER FOR CAP TO

CONTROLL STRING FLOW
00:00 -05:00 5.00 TRP 2 TRIP TO SHOE SLOW- WOULD NOT TAKE DISPLACEMENTOF PIPE
05:00 -06:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BTMS UP

10/19/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC & COND. @SHOE- O-5' FLARE
07:30 -08:00 0.50 WCL 3 FLOW CHECK- WELL FLOWINF 19% STAND PIPE HELD 453 DOWND TO

280PSI IN 30 MIN AND GAINED 50 BBLS
08:00 -12:00 4.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT SPOT 16.2 35 BBL PILL AT SHOE CAPED WI 15.3 35 BBL PILL AND

TRIP 17 STAND SWABBING THE HOLE .5 TO 1.5 BBLS A STAND.
12:00 -13:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC BTMS UP- 1TO 2' FLARE
13:00 - 22:30 9.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT- PUMP 16.6 PILL TRIP OUT STILL SWABBING .5 TO 1 BBL PER

STAND UNTIL 15 STANDS PULLED STARTED TO BREAK OVER AND TAKE
FLUID 1.5 TO 2 BBLS OVER CALCULATION PER 5 STANDS.

22:30 -02:30 4.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN- CHANGE OUT MOTOR AND P/U BIT SUB AND TRIP IN CHANGE
ROTATING HEAD RUBBER TRIP 3700

02:30 -03:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC BTMS UP- S' FLARE
03:00 -05:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN 5895 SLOW
05:00 -06:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC & COND - WORKING ON GETTING VIS DOWN Fl93

10/20/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 CIRC 1 CIRC.&COND.- VISVERY HIGH 93 RUN DRILL THIN AND WATER TO
DEHYDRATED MUD.

10:00 - 12:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP TO SHOE- WELL FLOWED BACK 80 BBLS 34 FLOWED PLUS 46 IN TOTAL
DISPLACEMENT OF PIPE

12:00 - 14:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.& COND- STILL WORKING ON HIGH VIS MUD AND CIRC GAS OUT 15/20'
FLARES

14:30 - 15:00 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN- TAG @9316
15:00 -22:00 7.00 REAM 1 WASH & REAM F/9316-9532
22:00 -23:00 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN 10 STANDSF/9532 TO 10503
23:00 -01:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC & COND.- CIRC OUT GAS AND COND MUD
01:00 -02:00 1.00 CIRC 1 TRIP IN 10 STANDS Fl 10503 TO 11500
02:00 -04:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC&COND- CIRCOUT HEAVY PILL AND MAINTAINMUD WT 14.6 PPG. AND

BUILD LCM CONTENT BACK UP TO 20%
04:00 -05:30 1.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN Fl 11500 TO 12689
05:30 -06:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC AND COND.- CIRC BTMS UP

10/21/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD - BlULD LCM CONTENT BACK UP & DROP
THE HIGH VIS

07:00 - 17:30 10.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM OUT OF GAGE HOLE FROM 12,642 TO 12,954
17:30 -06:00 12.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 12,954 TO 13015

10/22/2007 06:00 -14:00 8.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 13,020 TO 13,143
14:00 -16:00 2.00 CIRC 2 LOST FULL RETURNS & SHUT WELL IN & SPOT 1-40 BBL LCM POLY SWEEPS
16:00 -17:30 1.50 TRP 2 OPEN UP WELL BORE & SINGLE OUT 9 JOINTSWITH KELLY @12807
17:30 -18:30 1.00 CIRC 2 SPOT 1-40 BBL LCM POLY SWEEP & PUMP 40 BBLSDOWN THE ANNULAS
18:30 -00:30 6.00 CIRC 6 BUILD VOLUME -PUMP 40BBLS MUD DOWN BACK SIDE TO SEE IF GET ANY

RETURNS BUILD 200 BBL PREMIX
00:30 -03:00 2.50 CIRC 1 CLOSE ANN. OPEN HCR- CIRC TROUGH CHOKE - STARTED SEEINGFLARE

@963 STKS-FLARE AROUND 80'- GOT RAW GAS @2670 STKS- HOLE TOOK
131 BBLSGOT FLOW BACK @5340

03:00 -06:00 3.00 CIRC 1 OPEN UP ANN. AND STARTED CIRCULATING DOWN FLOW LINE THROUGH
BUSTER STILL LOOSING MUD APPROX 150 BBLS MORE SO FAR. BUILDING
LCM BACK UP AND VOLUME.

10/23/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 CIRC 2 SPOT ANOTHER POLY SWELL PILL @2730 STK
07:00 -08:00 1.00 CIRC 1 LET POLLY PILL SET UP 45 MIN. MONITORING BACK SIDE WITH TRIP TANK
08:00 -08:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE & TRANSFER MUD FROM PREMIX TO ACTIVE BRING LCM UP TO
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10/23/2007 08:00-08:30 0.50 CIRC 1 25%
08:30 - 12:00 3.50 CIRC 6 FILL TRIP TANK CIRC.OVER THE TOP TO MONITOR WELL WHILE BUILDING

VOLUME FILL DRILL PIPE
12:00 - 14:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC & COND. LOST APPROX. 80 BBLS DURING CIRICULATION
14:00 -15:30 1.50 CIRC 6 CIRCACROSS TOP WHILE BUILDING VOLUME-BUILD 200 BBLS PREMIX
15:30 -18:00 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC & COND. LOST APPROX 66 BBLS
18:00 -19:30 1.50 CIRC 6 CIRCULATE ACROSS THE TOP AND BUILD VOLUME IN PREMIX 200 BBLS
19:30 -20:30 1.00 TRP 3 TRIP OUT L/D 6 JNTS 4 *

20:30 - 22:00 1.50 CIRC 6 CIRCULAT ACROSS TOP AND BUILD VOLUME
22:00 -02:00 4.00 CIRC 1 CIRC & COND. LOST APPROX. 51 BBLS
02:00 -05:00 3.00 CMT 3 R/U HALLIBURTON HOLD SAFETY MEETING AND SQUEEZE CEMENT INTO

BTM FORMATION @13143
05:00 - 05:30 0,50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT 3 STANDS
05:30 -06:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC OUT CEMENT IF ANY ABOVE THE BIT

10/24/2007 06:00 -08:30 2.50 WOT 1 CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD & WAIT ON CEMENT
08:30 - 22:00 13.50 REAM 1 REAM FROM 12,330 TO 12,837 & DRILL CEMENT STRINGERS
22:00 -00:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CONDITION MUD & CIRULATE (HOLE HEAVING 1/2 TO 1" CUTTING @12,837

TO 12,804
00:00 -06:00 6.00 REAM 1 WASH & REAM F/ 12837- 13129 8 DRILL CEMENT STRINGERS

10/25/2007 06:00 -10:30 4.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM 13,129' TO 13142' - COULD NOT MAKE BIT DRILL @ 13,142'
10:30 -12:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & CONDITION MUD FOR TRIP
12:00 -13:30 1.50 TRP 10 TOH 20 STANDSTO 11,100' - HOLE BALLONINGGIVING BACK MUD TOTAL 50

BBL.
13:30 - 15:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. BOTTOMS UP & SPOT 40 BBL. 16.2 PPG PILL AT 11,100'- WELL TOOK

BACK 35 BBL. MUD WHILE CIRC. (BALLONING)
15:00 - 18:00 300 TRP 10 TOH TO SHOE MONITORING ON TRIP TANK - WELL FLOWED BACK 35 BBL. -

AT 9500' WELL STOPPED FLOWING
18:00 -19:00 1 00 CIRC 1 CIRC.BOTTOMS UP A7 8600'
19:00 -03:30 8 50 TRP 10 TOH - AT 7300' HOLE STARTED TAKING CORRECT FILLUP
03:30 -06:00 2 50 TRP 10 CHANGE BITS - TIH / FUNCTION ALL BOP COMPONENTS

10/26/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4 00 TRP 10 TIH - CIRC@3000' -6000' - DROPPED DRILL STRING FROM SNAG ON SLIPS -

DROPPED 65 STANDS + 1 SINGLE D.P & BHA
TOTAL LENGTH 7628.31'

10:00 - 16:30 6 50 FISH 5 TIH OPEN ENDED D.P. & TAG TOP OF FISH @5480.30'
16:30 - 20:00 3 50 CIRC 1 PICK UP 5' ABOVE FISH TOP - CIRC. & CONDITION MUD TO 14.6 MUD WT

IN/OUT
20:00 - 20:30 0 50 FISH 5 SCREW INTO FISH & ESTABLISH CIRC.
20:30 -21:30 1 00 FISH 3 CIRC. OUT GAS -MAX40' FLARE
21:30 -03:30 6 00 FISH 3 JARRING UP ON FISH MAX95K OVERPULL - STRINGWT. 205,000 - MAX300K

PULL - JARS HITTING GOOD & FULL CIRC. WITH NO MUD LOSSES - JARRING
UP WITH SOKOVER

03:30 -06:00 2 50 FISH 3 CALLED SLAUGH FISHING SERVICES & CONTINUE JARRING ON STUCK PIPE
WHILE WAITING ON FREEPOINT & FISHING TOOLS

10/27/2007 06:00 -11:00 5 00 FISH 3 JARRING STUCK DRILL STRING&WAIT ON FREE POINT TO ARRIVE - ONLY
AVAILABLEPIPE RECOVERY WFD COMES FROM ROCK SPRINGS

11:00 - 14:30 3 50 FISH 4 RIU WFD WIRELINE FREE POINT TOOLS-RAN FREE POINT & TOOLS WOULD
NOT PASS THROUGH SECOND JT. HWDP @11,950'

14:30 - 18:00 3 50 FISH 4 RAN BACKOFF STRING SHOT & TAGGED UP @12,921°- THIS IS 17 INTO
SECOND DRILL COLLAR -PICKED UP INTO CONNECTION BETWEEN TOP 2
DCs & ATTEMPTED BACK OFF WITH STRING SHOT (400 GRAIN CHARGE) NO
SUCCESS - PULL W.L. OUT OF PIPE & FOUND WIRE LINE HAD PULLED OUT
OF ROPE SOCKET & LEFT ROPE SOCKET AND SINKER BAR INSIDE DCs.

18:00 -19:00 1 00 FISH 4 RETIE HEAD & ROPE SOCKET - WAIT ON W.L. FISHING TOOLS TO ARRIVE
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10/27/2007 19:00 - 20:30 1.50 FISH 4 P/U WFD WIRE LINE FISHING TOOLS- MADE RUN WITH O.S. &SPANG JARS -

DID NOT CATCH FISH
20:30 -22:00 1.60 FISH 4 ATTEMPT BACK OFF WITH STRING SHOT @12,82T - NOSUCCESS - DID NOT

BACK OFF
22:00 -00:30 2.50 FISH 4 WAIT ON FREE POINT TOOL TO ARRIVE LOCATION
00:30 -02:30 2.00 FISH 4 RAN FREEPOINT &FOUND PIPE FREE @12,796'
02:30 -03:00 0.50 FISH 4 RIG UP STRING SHOT
03:00 -05:00 2.00 FISH 4 RAN STRINGSHOT & MADE SUCCESSFUL BACK OFF @12,774' - 3RD JT.

HWDP ABOVE DRILL COLLARS
05:00 -06:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC.OUT ABOVE FISH

10/28/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. OUT GASFROM ABOVE FISH & CONDITION MUD 14 6 PPG IN & OUT -

MAX25' FLARE - CONDITION MUD 14.6 PPG. IN & OUT
FISH LEFT IN HOLE BIT- BIT SUB -9 EA. 5" DCs -XOVER -3 JTS. 4 1/2 14#XT
39 HWDP - TOP OF FISH IN HOLE 12,774'- STRING SHOT TOOLS LEFT
INSIDE FISH / ROPE SOCKET - SINKER BAR - CCL. - CONTACT SUB - SHOT
ROD 28' LENGTH

10:30 - 13:30 3.00 TRP 4 TOH WITH FISH TO 10,000'
13:30 -17:00 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & CONDITION OUT OF BALANCE MUD & PUMP SLUG
17:00 -03:00 10.00 TRP 4 TOH WITH FISH SLOWLY TOPREVENT SWABBING - UD 1 JT. BENT D P. - UD

2 JTS FROM FISH CONN. -L/D BOTTOM JT. HWDP - INSPECTED ALL HWDP &
NO BAD CONNS. FOUND

03:00 -06:00 3.00 TRP 1 MAKE UP SLAUGHS FISHING TOOLS - SIS - CIRC. SUB - BUMP SUB - JAR -9

(4 3/4") DCs - INTENSIFIER -XOVER - TIH
10/29/2007 06:00 -13:30 7.50 FISH 5 TIH WITH FISHING TOOLS - RETORQUE EA. D.P. CONNECTION

13:30 -16:00 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & CONDITION MUD AT SHOE 8700'
16:00 -19:00 3.00 TRP 2 TIH & TAG FISH @12,774' W.L. MEASUREMENT
19:00 - 20:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. OUT GAS & CONDITION MUD - MAX 25' FLARE
20:30 -06:00 9.50 FISH 3 SCREW INTO FISH AND ESTABLISH CIRC. - JARRING ON FISH

STRING WT. 195 K - JAR UP 285 K - MAX 300K PULL
TOP FISH 12,774' WFD W.L. MEASUREMENT
12,764' DRILLERS PIPE MEASUREMENT

10/30/2007 06:00 -06:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. PUMP 16.2 DRY SLUG
06:30 -09:00 2.50 FISH 4 SET BACK KELLY& MAKE GAUGE RUN WITH WFD W.L. SINKER BAR 1 7/16 -

TAG UP AT 12,913'
09:00 -11:00 2.00 FISH 4 RUN IN HOLE WITH FREE POINT TOOL
11:00 - 13:00 2.00 FISH 4 RUN IN HOLE WITH STRING SHOT. BACKED OFF WIRE LINE

MEASUREMENTS @ 12791'. RIG DOWN WIRE LINE CREW
13:00 -01:00 12.00 TRP 2 TOOH WITH FISHINGTOOLS. LEFT SLAUGH SCREW IN SUB IN HOLE. 3'.36"

LONG, 3 JTS. HWDP, XO, 9 DRILL COLLARS, XO,BIT. TOP OF FISH @12761'
(SLM).

01:00 -06:00 5.00 HELD PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING. MAKE UP BIT, WEATHERFORD FULL
GAUGE STRING REAMERS AND BHA.
TIH GAUGE RUN BEFORE RUNNING WHIP STOCK

10/31/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 TRP 15 TIH WITH 6 1/8" TRI CONE & WATERMELON MILLS FOR GAUGE RUN PRIOR
TO LOGGING & RUNNING WHIPSTOCK.

08:00 - 11:00 3.00 CIRC 1 CIRC. & CONDITION MUD AT SHOE 8700'
11:00 -12:30 1.50 RIG 6 CUT DRILL LINE
12:30 - 13:00 0.50 TRP 15 TIH / GAUGE RUN - TAG UP @9313'
13:00 - 16:00 3.00 CIRC 1 CIRC. AND CONDITION
16:00 -16:30 0.50 CIRC 1 BUILD & PUMP SLUG
16:30 -19:30 3.00 TRP 3 L/D 30 JTS D.P FOR REAMING & RAN 10 STANDS IN FROM DERRICK
19:30 -06:00 10.50 REAM 1 REAM FROM 9313' TO 9464'

HARD REAMING - SLOUGHING SHALE

Printed: 12/3/2007 10:31 01
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

11/1/2007 06:00 -13:30 7.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM FROM 9464' TO 9527'
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 RIG 4 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 OTH BUILD AND PUMP PILL
14:30 -00:00 9.50 TRP 10 TOOH, LAYDOWN FULL GAUGE BHA, REAMERSAND BIT LOOK GOOD. BIT IN

GAUGE, REAMERS 1/32 OUT
00:00 -03:00 3.00 TRP 10 MAKE UP NEW BHA, TIH WITH BIT #10 TO 2972'
03:00 - 03:30 0.50 CIRC 1 BREAK CIRCULATION
03:30-06:00 2.50 TRP 10 TIH

11/2/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 TRP 2 TIH to csg. shoe @8800'
07:00 - 10:30 3.50 CIRC 1 Fili pipe, circulate
10:30 - 12:00 1.50 TRP 2 TIH to 9464'
12:00 - 15:00 3.00 REAM i Wash & Ream Fl 9464' - 9868'
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 TRP 2 TIH to 10190'
15:30 -16:30 1.00 REAM 1 Wash & Ream F/ 10190° -10290'
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RIG 1 Lubricate rig
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 REAM 1 Wash & Ream Fl 10290' -

10321°

17:30 - 19:00 1.50 TRP 2 TIH to 12214'
19:00 -04:30 9.50 REAM 1 Wash & Ream Fl 12214' - 12,798 -DRILLERS MEASUREMENTS

TOP OF FISH 12,798'
04:30 -06:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.&CONDITION MUD

11/3/2007 06:00 - 12:30 6.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. & CONDITION MUD - SLUG PIPE & DROP SURVEY
12:30 -17:30 5.00 TRP 2 TOH TO SHOE - SLM
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG 1 SER. RIG
18:00 -01:30 7.50 TRP 2 FINISH TOH FOR LOGS - SLM
01:30 -02:30 1.00 LOG 1 SAFETY MEETING & RIG UP HALLIBURTON LOGGERS
02:30 -06:00 3.50 LOG 1 RAN GRINEU/RES. INDUCTION LOG - HOWCO TAGGED UP @12,740'

SLM TOP FISH 12,760.92

EXTENSION FOR BOP 30 DAY TEST GRANTED FOR 4 DAYS EMAIL FROM JIM
ASHLEY BLM

11/4/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 LOG 1 FINISH OPEN HOLE LOGGING,LOGGERS TD @12740', DRILL PIPE STRAP
12761'

08:00 -08:30 0.50 RIG 2 RIG SERVICE, CROWN AND BLOCKS , ETC.
08:30 -10:00 1.50 WOT 4 WAIT ON REAMERS, RIGGING UP STEAM LINES, CONDITIONING MUD
10:00 -11:30 1.50 TRP 1 MAKE UP BHA, UNDERGAUGE REAMERSFOR WHIPSTOCK
11:30 -12:30 1.00 TRP 15 TIH WITH REAMERS
12:30 -15:00 2.50 TRP 2 TOOH TO PICK UP WEATHERFORD WHIPSTOCK TOOL
15:00 - 18:00 3.00 TRP 15 MAKE UP BIT, AND SLICK ASSEMBLY, GASBUBBLING ABOVE ROTARY

TABLE, TIH TO 3900'
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND CONDITION MUD TO 14.8 PPG
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 TRP 15 TlH TO 6182'
20:00 - 21:30 1.50 TRP 15 CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND CONDITION MUD TO 14.8 PPG
21:30 -23:00 1.50 TRP 15 PUMP 20 BBL PILL AND TIH TO 8715'
23:00 -00:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND CONDITION MUD TO 14.8 PPG
00:30 -01:30 1.00 TRP 15 PUMP 20 BBL PILL AND TlH TO 10463'
01:30 -03:30 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT AND CONDITION MUD TO 14.5+

03:30 -04:30 1.00 TRP 15 TIH TO 12,400'
04:30 -06:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. OUT GAS * CONDITION MUD

11/5/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC. & CONDITION MUD TO 14.8 IN/OUT @12,400'
07:00 -08:30 1.50 TRP 2 SLUG & L.D. 12 JTS. D.P.
08:30 -09:00 0.50 TRP 2 RAN LAST 4 STANDS D.P. IN HOLE FROM DERRICK
09:00 - 11:30 2.50 REAM 1 REAM FROM 12,450' TO 12,657'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code S
e Description of Operations

11/5/2007 11:30 - 13:30 2.00 CIRC 2 HOLE TAKING MUD WITH 14.8 / 14.9 MUD WT - PUMP LCM SWEEPS &
LOWER MUD WT. TO 14.7 - LOST 260 BBL. MUD TOTAL BEFORE LOSSES
STABALIZED

13:30 -16:00 2.50 REAM i REAMED FROM 12,65T TO TOP OF FISH 12,762'
16:00 -21:00 5.00 CIRC 1 CIRC.&CONDITION FOR CEMENT PLUG, WAIT ON HALLIBURTON
21:00 -00:00 3.00 CIRC 1 RIG UP HALLIBURTON, HOLE PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING, CIRCULATE
00:00 -02:00 2.00 CMT 4 TEST LINESTO 1500 PSI. SET 150 SX BALANCE PLUG. 17.5 PPG, .94 YIELD,

3.33 GALISK, ESTIMATED TOP OF CEMENT @12069',
02:00 -03:00 1,00 TRP 2 TOOH TO 11924
03:00 -04:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITON HOLE
04:00-06:00 2.00 TRP 2 TOOH

11/6/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 TRP 2 TOOH - SPOT 40 BBL. 16.2 @10,000' & 8700' - HOLE BALLONING
HOLE STOPPED BALLON1NG@7000' & STARTED TAKING CORRECT FILLUP

NOTIFIED BLM CLIFF JOHNSON OF UPCOMING BOP TEST BY TELEPHONE
07:30 -08:30 1.00 CIRC 1 BUILD 40 BBL 16.2 SLUG AND PUMP
08:30 -09:30 1.00 TRP 2 TOOH TO 8700'
09:30 - 10:30 1.00 CIRC 1 BUILD 40 BBL 16.2 SLUG AND PUMP
10:30 -17:30 7.00 TRP 2 TOOH
17:30 - 22:00 4.50 BOP 2 TEST BOPANDALLVALVESANDLINES,CHOKEMANIFOLDTO250 PSI LOW

AND 10000 PSI HIGH (OK). TEST HYORILL TO 250 PSI LOW AND 5000 PSI
HIGH (OK).

22:00 - 22:30 0.50 BOP 2 RIG DOWN BOP TESTER
22:30 -01:00 2.50 TRP 2 TlH W1THSLICK DRILLING ASSEMBLY to 3005'
01:00 -01:30 0.50 CIRC 1 FILL PIPE
01:30 -03:00 1.50 TRP 2 TIH TO 6019'
03:00 -03:30 0.50 CIRC 1 FILL PIPE
03:30 -05:00 1.50 TRP 2 TIH TO SHOE
05:00 -06:00 1.00 RIG 6 CUT DRILL LINE

11/7/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE - CIRC. AT 8750 WHILE CUTTING LINE
07:00 -09:00 2.00 TRP 2 TIH TO 11000'
09:00 - 11:30 2.50 C1RC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
11:30 - 13:30 2.00 TRP 2 TOOH 27 JTS LAYING DOWN PIPE
13:30 -14:30 1.00 TRP 2 TIH LAST STANDS FROM DERRICK TO 10870' - DERRICK CLEANED UP
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 TRP 2 WASH & REAM FI 10870' -10910'

15:00 -15:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
15:30 - 17:30 2 00 DRL 4 DRILLED CEMENT FROM 12,03T TO 12,052' - @ 12052' 12K WOB AND

CEMENT WOULD NOT DRILL OFF - PLUG BACK IS HARD & SOLID
17:30 -19:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP AND BUILD PILL
19:00 -06:00 11.00 TRP 2 PUMPED PILL TO DRY PIPE FOR TRIP - BIT PLUGGED, TOOH WITH WET

DRILL STRING, SLM - TRIED THREE TIMES TO UNPLUG STRING WITH NO
SUCCESS.

11/8/2007 06:00 -10:00 4.00 TRP 12 TRIP OUT FOR SIDETRACK BHA
10:00 - 15:30 5.50 TRP 1 CHANGED OUT BHA FOR 1.83 BENT HOUSING MOTOR. ORIENT TOOL,

PICKED UP COLLARS. LAY COLLARS BACK DOWN.
15:30 - 16:00 0 50 RIG 1 SERVICED RIG.
16:00 -18:00 2.00 TRP 12 TRIPPED IN THE HOLE WITH DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.
18:00 -18:30 0.50 CIRC 1 FILLED PIPE & TESTED MWD.
18:30 -22:30 4.00 TRP 12 tRIPPED IN THE HOLE FILLING PIPE @4000' AND 8000'.
22:30 -02:30 4.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATED AND CONDITIONED MUD. MUD CUT FROM 14 6 TO 14.1# PER

GALLON. WELL OUT OF BALANCED FLOWING 6" STREAM.
02:30 -05:00 2.50 TRP 12 TRIPPED IN THE HOLE TO 11962'.
05:00 -06:00 1.00 CIRC 1 BROKE CIRCULATION PRIOR TO WASHINGDOWN TO THE PLUG @12052'

Printed 12/3/2007 10 31:01
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Description of Operations

11/9/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP.
07:00 -09:00 2.00 DRL 3 ATTEMPTED TO ORIENT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.
09:00 -09:30 0.50 DRL 2 TIME DRILLED CUTTING TROUGH IN FORMATION @12052'
09:30 - 10:30 1.00 RIG 2 CHANGED OUT PUMP EXPENDIBLES.
10:30 -14:00 3.50 DRL 1 TIME DRILLED FROM 12052 TO 12053' WITH ROTARY. WITH 1K ON BIT.
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLED WITH ROTARY FROM 12053 TO 12062'.
14:30 -16:30 2.00 DRL 3 TROUBLE SHOT MWD COULDN'T GET SURVEY.
16:30 - 17:30 1.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONALLY DRILLED FROM 12062' TO 12063'
17:30 - 19:00 1.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 12063' TO 12095'
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 CIRC 5 CIRCULATED BTMS UP FOR SAMPLES. NO CEMENT IN SAMPLES.
20:00 -00:30 4.50 DRL 1 ROTARY DRILLED FROM 12095 TO 12191'
00:30 -01:00 0.50 BOP 1 CHANGED OUT ROTATING HEAD RUBBER.
01:00 -04:30 3.50 LOG 4 RIGGED UP MULTI SHOT AND RAN SURVEY TO VERIFY ORIENTATION AT

12052' AND SURVEY AT 12121'.
04:30 -06:00 1.50 DRL 1 DRILLED FROM 12121 TO 12224

11/10/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 DRL 1 ROTARY DRILLED FROM 12224' to 12256'.
07:30 -08:30 1.00 CIRC 5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP FOR SAMPLES.
08:30 -09:00 0.50 DRL 1 ROTARY DRILLED FROM 12256' TO 12279'
09:00 - 10:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATED AND BUILT PILL CHECKED FOR FLOW.
10:30 -13:00 2.50 TRP 10 TRIPPEO TO SHOE LAYED DOWN 1 BAD JOINT DRILL PIPE FROM STRING.
13:00 -15:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP SPOTTED 16.6# PILL WI 306STKS FOLLOWED W/

592.
15:30 - 18:00 2.50 TRP 12 TRIPPED OUT OF THE HOLE.
18:00 - 19:30 1.50 RIG 2 SHUT DOWN AND REPAIRED PIPE SPINNERS.
19:30 -01:00 5.50 TRP 12 TRIPPED OUT OF THE HOLE WET LAYED DOWN MOTOR AND MWD TOOL.
01:00 -02:00 1.00 TRP 1 PICKED UP NEW MOTOR AND MWD.
02:00 -03:00 1.00 DRL 3 ORIENT MWD.
03:00 -06:00 3.00 TRP 2 TRIPPED IN THE HOLE.

11/11/2007 06:00 -06:30 0.50 BOP 1 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
06:30 -07:30 1.00 CIRC 3 FILL PIPE TOTEST MWD TOOL PRESSURED UP PLUGGED STRING

ATTEMPT TO UNPLUG NO LUCK
07:30 -10:00 2.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT WET Fl4000' PLUGGED TOP OF FIRST MONEL DOWN TO BIT W/

LCM & SOLIDS
10:00 - 12:00 2.00 TRP 1 L/D MWD TOOL, NMDC, MOTOR & BIT
12:00 - 17:30 5.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE SHAKE OUT LCM & SOLIDS
17:30 -18:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICED RIG
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 TRP 1 PICKED UP MOTOR AND MWD AND TESTED MWD.PICKED UP MOTOR AND

MWD AND TRIPPED IN THE HOLE W/ BHA AND TESTED.
19:00 -01:00 6.00 TRP 2 TRIPPED IN THE HOLE TO 1200 BROKE CIRCULATION AND @4000'. TESTED

MWD AND TEST WAS GOOD.TRIPPED IN THE HOLE TO 4000' AND BROKE
CIRCULATION. TESTED MWD AND TEST WAS GOOD. SURVEY 1.5 DEGRESS
AND 45 AZIMUTH @4033'. TESTED @6000'SURVEY GOOD.

01:00 -02:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP @9100', GAS 2400 UNITS.MWD GOOD.
02:00 -04:00 2.00 TRP 10 TRIPPED IN THE HOLE AND LAYED DOWN 4 JOINTS DRILL PIPE FOR

SURVEYS. SURVEY @ 12002' GOOD.
04:00 -06:00 2.00 SUR 1 SURVEYED 30' INTERVALS IN THE HOLE.

11/12/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BTMS UP AFTER TRIP- 15/20FT FLARE
07:00 - 14:00 7.00 DRL 7 DRLG- SLIDE FI 12279-12289- ROTATE FI 12289 TO 12309- SLIDE FI 12309 TO

12321
14:00 -14:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
14:30 -02:00 11.50 DRL 7 DRLG-ROTATE FI 12321 TO 12341- SLIDE FI 12341 TO 12363 -ROTATE FI

12363-12387
02:00 -06:00 4.00 DRL 7 TIME DRILL 1FOOT PER HOUR F/12387- 12390

Printed 12/3/2007 10:31:01
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/13/2007 06:00 -08:00 2 00 DRL 7 DRILL ACTUAL - SLIDE FI 12390 TO 12396, TIME DRILLING 1 FOOT PER HOUR
08:00 -08:30 0 50 DRL 7 DRILL ACTUAL - ROTATING F/ 12398 TO 12419
08:30 -09:30 1 00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BUILD & PUMP PILL
09:30 -12:00 2.50 TRP 10 TRIP - POOH TO SHOE
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 RIG 6 CUT OFF DRILLING LINE - CUT 10 WRAPS 55'
13:30 - 15:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BTMS UP SPOT PILL W/ 306 STKS CHASE W/ 592 STKS REST OF

PILL 408 STKS 16.6 PPG
15:00 - 20:00 5.00 TRP 10 TRIPS- POOH
20:00 - 21:00 1.00 TRP 1 TRIPS - CHANGE MOTOR & BIT CHECK AND OREINT TOOLS
21:00 - 01:00 4.00 TRP 2 TRIPS -TIH TO CASING SHOE
01:00 -02:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BTMS UP BELOW SHOE 5/10 FT FLARE
02:30 -04:30 2 00 TRP 2 FINISH TRIP IN
04:30 -06:00 1 50 CIRC 1 CIRC BTMS UP

11/14/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8 00| DRL 7 DRILL ACTUAL -SLIDE f 12419 TO 12434
14:00 -15:00 1 00 DRL 2 DRILL ACTUAL -ROTATING F/12434 TO 12452, 2K ON BIT
15:00 -00:30 9 50 DRL 7 DRILL ACTUAL -SLIDING F/12452 TO 12474

00:30 -01:30 1 00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BUILD PUMP 10% LCM SWEEP
01:30 -06:00 4 50 DRL 7 DRILL ACTUAL - SLIDINGF/12472 TO 12484

11/15/2007 06:00 -10:00 4 00 DRL 7 DRILL ACTUAL - SLIDE FI 12484 TO 12492, ROT F/12492 TO 12517
10:00 -17:30 7 50 DRL 7 TIMED DRILL Fl 12517 TO 12524, TIME DRILLING 1 FOOT PER HOUR
17:30 - 18:00 0 50 RIG 1 ROUTINE RIG SERVICE
18:00 -06:00 12 00 DRL 7 DRILL ACTUAL - FI 12524 TO 12535, TIMED DRLG 1 FOOT PER HOUR

11/16/2007 06:00 - 17:30 11 50 DRL 7 DRLG ACTUAL - SLIDE TIMED DRILL F/12535 TO 12547 1FT PER HR
17:30 - 18:00 0 50 RIG 1 ROUTINE RIG SERVICE
18:00 -06:00 12 00 DRL 7 DRLG ACTUAL - SLIDE TIMED DRILL F/12547 TO 12552 1 FT PER HR & F/12552

TO 12566 2FT PER HR
11/17/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5 50 DRL 7 TIME DRILL @3FT HR-F/12566 TO12582 CMT 2-3%

11:30 -12:00 0 50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:00 -13:00 1 00 DRL 7 TIME DRILL@3 FT HR. F/ 12582 TO 12586 CMT 2-30%
13:00 -19:30 6 50 DRL 7 DRLG ROTATE F/12586-12750- CMT 30-100%
19:30 - 21:30 2 00 DRL 7 DRLG- SLIDE Fl 12750-12762
21:30 - 22:30 1 00 DRL 7 TRY TO SLIDE PAST THEFISH ON THE LOW SIDE TORQUE UP AND

PRESSURE UP GET STICKY
22:30 -00:30 2 00 CIRC 1 CIRCULAT BTMS UP AND SPOT 20BBLS 16.5 PPG PILL @ 12762
00:30 -03:30 3 00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT TO SHOE
03:30 -05:00 1 50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND SPOT 20 BBLS 16.5 PPG PILL A SHOE
05:00 -06:00 1 00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT FI WHIP STOCK

11/18/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5 50 TRP 2 TRIP F/ WHIP STOCK- L/D JARS & DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:00 -15:30 3.50 WOT 4 WAIT ON 6" MILL& STRING FLOAT
15:30 - 18:00 2.50 TRP 2 P/U WHIPSTOCK & MILL& TRIP IN
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 RIG 2 RIG REPAIR- WORK ON AIR SPINNERS
19:00 -04:30 9.50 TRP 2 FINISH TRIP IN ANCHOR @12510 TOP OF THE WHIPSTOCK WILL BE @ 12490
04:30 -06:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC BTMS UP BEFORE SETTING ANCHOR

11/19/2007 06:00 -06:30 0 50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BTMS UP
06:30 -07:30 1 00 DRL 3 SET WHIPSTOCK ANCHOR @12504 Wl4000 PSI & 35K TO SHEAR AND

RELEASE WHIPSTOCK.
07:30 -08:00 0 50 DRL 2 DRESS WHIPSTOCK AND DRILL 2' RAT HOLE
08:00 -09:30 1 50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BTMS UP CLEAN TOP WHIP. PUMP PILL
09:30 -12:00 2 50 TRP 2 TRIP TO SHOE
12:00 - 13:30 1 50 RIG 6 SLIP & CUT DRLG LINE 77' 14 WRAPS
13:30 -14:30 1 00 CIRC 1 CIRC & SPOT 20 BBLS 16.5 PPG PILL @SHOE

Printed 12/3/2007 10:31:01
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Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code e Description of Operations

11/19/2007 14:30 - 19:00 4.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT W/ MILL
19:00 -20:00 1.00 TRP 1 L/D MILL,RUNNIN SUB, BYPASS VALVE SUB, STRING FLOAT & P/U 404 ZtBIT

& MOTOR .17

20:00 -03:30 7.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN P/U JARS & BREAK CIRC @BHA @4000'@ SHOE
03:30 -05:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRC BTMS UP
05:00 -05:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM F/12450 TO 12484
05:30 -06:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRLG Fl 12484 TO 12491

11/20/2007 06:00-15:30 9.50 DRL 1 DRLGF/12491-12556
15:30 -16:00 0 50 BOP 1 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER
16:00 - 16:30 0 50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 06:00 13 50 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 12556-12712

11/21/2007 06:00 -14:00 8 00 DRL 1 DRLG F/ 12712 TO 12772
14:00 - 15:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC BTMS UP
15:00 -15:30 0.50 SUR 1 PUMP SURVEY & PILL
15:30 -18:30 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP TO SHOE
18:30 - 20:30 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC BTMS UP SPOT 16.5 PPG 20 BBLS
20:30 -02:00 5.50 CIRC 1 FINISH TRIP OUT L/D .17 HUNTING MOTOR & BIT
02:00 - 02:30 0.50 TRP 1 P/U 2.2 MOTOR RUN IN TEST WI KELLY -@ 144 gpm 287 psi-@ 150 gpm 309

psi-@ 175 gpm 365 psi
02:30 -06:00 3.50 TRP 2 P/U NEW BIT BC IMPREG-& TRIP IN BREAK CIRC @BHA @4000

11/22/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE TO SHOE
08:00 -09:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
09:30 -11:30 2.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE(TAGGED UP @WHIPSTACK
11:30 -12:30 1.00 OTH TRY TO WORK BIT PAST WHIPSTACK. WOULD NOT GO
12:30 -14:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP-10' FLAIR
14:00 -17:00 3.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CHANE OUT BHA
17:00 - 18:00 1,00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE, SPOT P1LLA SHOE AND PUMP TRIP SLUG
18:00 -23:00 5.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
23:00 -00:00 1.00 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT MOTORS AND PICK UP BIT #16
00:00 -04:00 4.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE, FILL @BHA,4000'
04:00 -05:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE SLUG OUT OF HOLE @SHOE
05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE

11/23/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE WIT BIT #16- NO DRAGGOING BY WHIP STOCK
07:00 -08:30 1.50 REAM 1 WASH 100 TO BOTTOM, NO FILL-CIRCULAE GAS OUT
08:30 - 15:00 6.50 DRL 1 DRILLING F/12772 T/12847 75' 11.5'lHR
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, SLOW PUMP RATES
15:30 - 06:00 14.50 DRL 1 DRILLING F/12847 T/12886 39' 2.8'/HR

11/24/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE, SPOT SLUGS.
07:30 - 14:30 7.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR NEW BIT
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 TRP 10 CHANGE OUT BITS AND CHECK MOTOR
15:00 -19:00 4.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE, FILL @4100'
19:00 -20:00 1.00 RIG 6 CUT DRILLING LINE
20:00 -21:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
21:00 - 23:00 2.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE
23:00 -00:00 1.00 REAM 1 WASH 50' TO BOTTOM-NO FILL-BOTTOMS UP GAS 1750 UNIT AND 15' FLARE
00:00 - 06:00 6.00 DRL 1 DRILLING F/12886 T/12935 49' 8 t'/HR

11/25/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRILLING F/12935 T/12967 32° 8 O'lHR
10:00 -10:30 0.50 REAM 1 HOLE FELL IN, REAM BACK TO BOTTOM
10:30 - 05:00 18.50 DRL 1 DRILLING F/12967 T/13086 119° 6.4'lHR
05:00 -06:00 1.00 CIRC 2 LOST CIRCULATION @13086'. MIXAND PUMP LCM SWEEPS.

11/26/2007 06:00 -06:30 0.50 CIRC 1 SPOT LCM SWEEP ON BOTTOM
06:30 -07:30 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE 6 STANDS
07:30 -08:30 1.00 CIRC 1 SPOT 2ND LCM SWEEP

Printed 12/3/2007 10 31 01



Questar E & P Page 15 of 15

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 111

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/26/2007 08:30 -10:00 1.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO 11000'
10:00 -11:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULE BOTTOMS UP, CHECK WELL AND PUMP SLUG
11:00 -17:00 6.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE. SLM= 5.60' LONG- NO CORRECTION
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 TRP 10 LAY DOWN MOTOR.PICK UP BIT SUB AND NEW BIT
17:30 -22:00 4.50 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT #17 TP SHOE
22:00 -23:30 1.50 CIRC 1 C1RCULATE BOTTOMS UP AT CASING SHOE
23:30 -01:30 2.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE, TAGGED UP @12862'
01:30 -05:00 3.50 REAM 1 REAM F/12838 T/13086 BOTTOMS UP GAS3000 UNITS AND 35' FLARE
05:00 - 06:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRILLING F/13086 T/13090

11/27/2007 06:00 -02:00 20.00 DRL 1 DRILLING F/13090 T/13210 120' 6.0'/HR
LOST 15 BBLS OF MUD @13154'

02:00 -04:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR SHOT TRIP
04:30 -05:30 1.00 TRP 14 SHORT TRIP 10 STANDS
05:30 -06:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE TO LAY DOWN DRILL P1PE

11/28/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE.SPOT HEAVY SLUG ON BOTTOM AND
PUMP TRIP SLUG. RIG UP LAY DOWN TRUCK AND HOLD SAFETY MEETING

08:00 -22:00 14.00 TRP 3 LAY DOWN 4" DRILL PIPE AND BHA,BREAK KELLY
STOP A SHOE AND MONITOR WELL FOR 30 MIN.

22:00 -23:00 1.00 CSG 1 RIG UP CASING CREW AND HOLD SAFETY MEETING
23:00 -06:00 7.00 CSG 2 RUN 4 1/2" CASING

11/29/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 ClRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP AT CASING SHOE
07:30 - 11:00 3.50 CSG 2 RUN 4 1/2" CASING - CASING SET @ 13204 RUN 302 JTS-PIGGY BACKED

FLOAT SHOE & COLLAR.
11:00 - 15:00 4.00 CIRC 1 CIRC OUT LCM WHILE WAITING ON CEMENT
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 CMT 1 R/U AND HOLD SAFETY MEETING W/ HALLIBURTON
15:30 - 18:30 3.00 CMT 2 CEMENT WI HALLIBURTON - PUMP 10 BBLS FRESH WATER-PUMP 30BBLS

14.8 PPG TUNED SPACER-10 BBLS FRESH WATER- PUMPED 200 BBLS 15
PPG LEAD CEMENT 850 SKS W/ YP 1.32 -- DISPLACED W/ 19388LS OF 8.4
PPG CLAYFIXWATER BUMPED PLUG 193 BBLS 5500 PSI F/ 3 MIN. BLED
BACK 3.5 BBLS FLOATS HELD -PUMPED 3BBLS MIN. - LAST 20 BBLS 1.2 BBLS
MIN.

18:30 - 22:00 3.50 BOP 1 NIPPLE DOWN BOPS TO SET SLIPS
22:00 - 23:30 1.50 CSG 7 SET SLIPS @156000 STRING WT. CUT OFF CSG.
23:30 -01:30 2.00 BOP 1 SET OUT KELLYAND 4" SUBS AND TOOLS
01:30 -06:00 4.50 BOP 1 FINISH NIPPLE DOWN BOPS & SET OUT

11/30/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 BOP 1 FINISH N/D BOPS & SET OUT
07:30 - 18:00 10.60 LOC 7 SUCK OUT &CLEAN MUD TANKS- HUAL OFF 4" DRILL PIPE & BHA TO TOWN

TO BE INSPECTED- HUAL OFF MUD PRODUCTS- L/D SOME WINOWALL &
BRIDLE UP

12/1/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 LOC 4 LAY DERRICK OVER READY RIG Fl TRUCKS
18:00 -06:00 12.00 W/O DAY LIGHTS-25% RIG DOWN

Printed 12/3/2007 10 31 01





NOTICE

Utah Oiland Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oil or gas or when well testingas required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the followingshall be filed:
• Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log
• A copyof electricand radioactivity logs, if run
• A copy of drillstem test reports,
• A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluid saturation

determinations
• A copy of core analyses, and lithologic logs or sample descriptions if compiled
• A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for

each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timelymanner willresult in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining, and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of the mailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: Questar Exploration & Production Co Today's Date: 02/14/2008

Well: API Number: Drilling Commenced:
See Attachment

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance



Well: API Number: Commenced:
WV 5W-36-7-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304734099 05/29/2003
WV 4D-12-8-12 drlg rpts/wcr 4304734268 09/26/2003
WVX 11D-22-8-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304734902 03/15/2005
WV 3DML-13-8-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304737923 09/27/2006
FR 7P-36-14-19 drlg rpts/wcr 4304738992 02/05/2007
SU 8M-12-7-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304736096 03/18/2007
WV 12AD-8-8-22R drlg rpts/wcr 4304739321 05/10/2007
WRU EIH 7AD-35-8-22 drlg rpts/wcr 4304738641 06/08/2007
RWS 14D-6-9-24 drlg rpts/wcr 4304737414 07/20/2007
RW 34-27ADR drlg rpts/wcr 4304739445 08/07/2007
NBZ 8D-31-8-24 drlg rpts/wcr 4304737238 08/27/2007
WRU EIH 6D-5-8-23 drlg rpts/wcr 4304738994 09/04/2007
WRU EIH 9CD-26-8-22 drlg rpts/wcr 4304738649



STATEOF UTAH FoRM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE ORSAWlORANIŒSERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-77301

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTSON WELLS & FINDIAN.ALÇO)?EEdgTRIBENAME:

7. UNITorCA AGREEMENT NAME:Do notuse thisform for proposalsto drill newwells,significantlydeepen existingweilebelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterpluggedwells,orto SIG VALLEYUNIT# UTU-81308Xdrill horizonlailaterals, Use APPLICAT10N FOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF VfELL 8 WELLNAMEand NUMBERiOIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER NBŽ8D-31-8-24
2. NAMEOFgTOR: APfNUMSg|t
Questar Exploration & Production Co. Contact: Laura Bills 43 047a3 238

3. ADDRESSOFOPERATOR: PHþNEþU El 10 FIBkgÃNOPOOt;ORWitDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S. Vernal ,, Ut »,84078 (4 $¶78143011 UNDESIGNATED

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1581' I¯NL1233' FEL COUNW: UINTAH
OTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENE 31 88 24Ei STATE:

UTAH

« CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDRE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillsta t CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK O WATER DISPOSAL(Submit OrIginal Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUM WATER SHUT-OFFDate ofworkcompletion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS, Clearly show all pertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes,etc

Questar Exploration & Production Company hereby requests the commingling of production between the Wasatch, Mancos
and Dakota intervals in the NBZ 8D-31-8-24. Questar considers thiscommingling to be in the public interest in that it promotes
maximum ultimate economic recovery, prevents waste, provides for orderly and efficient production of oil and gas and presents
no detrimental effects from comminglingthe twogas streams. A productionlog willbe ran in 30 days witha subsequent reportto followwith allocations.

RECEIVED

80Pytilt1e FEBB 2008

Dile: D\V.0F0\L,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Laura Bills
TITLE ASsociate RegulatoryAffairsAnalyst

SIGNATURE DATE 2/6/2008

(Thisspaceforstateussonly) Utah DÌVÍSÍOD O
ActionisNecessaryOil, Gas and ¶ning

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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AFFIDAVIT OF NOTICE

STATE OF COLORADO )
COUNTY OF DENVER ) ss:

Chad W. Matney, being duly sworn, deposes and says:

1. That I am employed by QuestarMarket Resources in the capacity as a
Landman. My business address is Independence Plaza

1050 17 Street, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265

2. In my capacity as a Landman, pursuant to the provisions of Utah
Administrative Rule 615-3-22 I have provided a copy of QuestarMarket
Resource's application for completion of the NBZ 8D-31-8-24 well into two
or more pools, in the form of Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining's Form 9
Sundry Notice, to owners of all contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units
overlying the pools which are the subject of that application.

3. In my capacity as a Landman I am authorized to provide such notice of
QuestarMarket Resource's application to contiguous owners and to make this
affidavit on this 12 day of February, 2008.

Printed Name: Cha W. Matney

The foregoing instrument was sworn to and subscribed before me this \ a day of
February, 2008, by Chad W. Matney.

Notary Public

My Commission expires: , , I \ \

OROFOL,GAS&



Fonn 3160-4 Form approved.
(November 1983) UNITED STATES SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE Budget Bureau No. 1004-0137

(fgrgerly 9-330) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR (See other in- Expires August 31, 1985
BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT structionson

reverse side). 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
UTU-77301

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG * N/A

la. TYPEOFWELL OIL GAS 7 UNITAGREEMENTNAME
WELL WELL DRY Other BIG VALLEY UNIT

b TYPE OF COMPLETION #UTU-81308X

NEW WORK DEEP PLUG DIFF. 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
WELL OVER EN BACK RESVR Other

i. NAME OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. NBZ 8D 31 8 24

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. Contact: Dahn CaldweH 435-781-4342 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH - VERNAL, UT 84078 Fax # 435.781.4357

4. LOCATIONOFWELL(RqortlocadoncleartyandinaccordancewithanyStarerquir )* UNDESIGNATED

At surface 1581' FNL, 1233' FEL, SENE, SEC 31-TSS-R24E 11. SEC.,T., R., M.,OR BLOCK AND SURVEY
OR AREA

At top rod interval opolted below 1581' FNL, 1233' FEL, SENE, SEC 31-TSS-R24E SEC 31-T8S-R24E

At total depth 1581' FNL, 1233' FEL, SENE, SEC 31-T8S-R24E
14. PERMITNO. DATEISSUED 12. COUNTYOR 13. STATE

PARISH
43-047-37238 UINTAH UT

15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (Ready to prod) 18. ELEVATIONS (Di RKB, RT, GR, Elt.)* 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD
8/27/07 11/26/07 2/1/08 'B

20. TOTALDEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
HOW MANY* DRILLED BY

13,210' 13,202' ----> X
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTIDM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL

SURVEY MADE
SEE ATTACHMENT PG 1

NO

26. BA
OM

TLR
RESISTIVITY DSN, CBL/GR $6 % is 16 , L ,

27. WASWELL CORED

28. CASING ORD (Report aB strings set in wea)

CASING SIZE WEIGERLB./FT. DEFIH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED
9-5/8" 36# 2225' 12-1/4" 650 SXS

7" 26# 8800' 8-3/4" 1260 SXS
4-1/2" 13.5 & 15.1# 13204' 6-1/8" 850 SXS

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTIDM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPlH SET (MD) PACKER SET(MD)

/A N/A
31. PERFORATION RECORD gntermt size andnumber) 32. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SOUEEZE,E10.
SEE ATTACHMENT PAGE ONE DEVIH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

SEE ATTACHMENT PG 1 SEE ATTACHMENT PG 1

33.* PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing,gas hyt,pumping-size and type ofpump) WELL STATUS(Producing or

shut-in)

2/1/2008 FLOWING PRODUCING
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N FOR OUBBL. GAS-MCF. WATER-BBL. GAS-OIL RAT10

TEST PERIOD
2/4/08 24 24 65 3,389 1,615

FLOW. TUBINGPRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL-BBL. GAS-MCF WATER-BBL OIL GRAVITY-API(CORR.)
24-HOUR RATE

N/A 2,690
34. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, usedfor fuel,unted, etc.) TE I-IVEbSOLD
35. LISTOFATTACHMENTS

WELLBORE SCHEMATIC & PERFORATION DETAIL ATTACHMENT PAGE ONE
NyEcD-Jthattheforegon d attached infognatio plete and from d a

LETION SUPERVISOR I EOFOIL,GAf/82 «

(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any dep
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its juris
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NBZ 8D 31 8 24 - ATTACHMENT PAGE ONE
PERFORATION DETAIL:
Oppp imulagon Perf Status

4924' - 4928' Open - Wasatch

4938' - 4940' Open - Wasatch
5179'- 5183' Frac w/ 48,211 Lbs in 23,814 Gals Open - Wasatch
5212' - 5216' Open - Wasatch
5232' - 5234' Open - Wasatch

5513' - 5515' Open - Wasatch
5726'- 5734' Frac w/ 51,026 Lbs in 23,562 Gals Open - Wasatch

8813' - 8815' Open - Blackhawk
8859'-8861' Open - Blackhawk
8922' - 8930' Frac w/ 82,001 Lbs in 100,422 Gals Open - Blackhawk
8960' - 8962' Open - Blackhawk
8994' - 8996' Open - Blackhawk

9150' - 9154' Open - Mancos 'B'
9390'-9392' Open - Mancos'B'
9422'-9424' Open - Mancos 'B'
9434'-9436' Frac w/ 40,449 Lbs in 143,850 Gals Open - Mancos 'B'
9456'-9460' Open - Mancos 'B'
9482'-9484' Open - Mancos 'B'

,v Open - Mancos
10368' - 10370' Open - Mancos
10426' - 10428' Open - Mancos
10460'- 10462' Open - Mancos
10488'- 10490' Frac w/ 40,000 Lbs in 152,544 Gals Open - Mancos
10510' - 10512' Open - Frontier
10542' - 10544' Open - Frontier
10580' - 10582' Open - Frontier

10716' - 10718' Open - Mancos
10730'- 10732' Open - Mancos
10742'- 10744' Open - Mancos
10789'-10791' Open - Mancos
10848'-10850' Frac w/ 39,800 Lbs in 140,238 Open - Mancos
10878' - 10880' Open - Frontier
10941' - 10943' Open - Frontier
10968' - 10970' Open -



11096'- 11098' Open - Mancos
11114' - 11116' Open - Mancos
11164'- 11166' Open - Mancos
11190'- 11192' Open - Mancos
11264'- 11266' Frac w/ 40,300 Lbs in 144,396 Gals Õpen- Mancos
11274' - 11276' Open - Mancos
11343' - 11345' Open - Mancos
11373' - 11375' Õpen- Mancos

11564' - 11566' Open - Mancos
11582'- 11584' Open - Mancos
11598'- 11600' Open - Mancos
11636' - 11638' Open - Mancos
11703'- 11705' Frac w/ 39,901 Lbs in 141,750 Gals ÕpenMancos
11756' - 11758' Open - Frontier
11780' - 11782' Open - Frontier
11820' - 11822' Open - Frontier

11964' - 11966' Open - Frontier
12002' - 12004' Open - Frontier
12030' - 12032' Open - Frontier
12052' - 12054' Open - Frontier
12106'- 12108' Frac w/ 40,085 Lbs in 141,582 Gals Open - Frontier
12144'- 12146' Open - Frontier
12160' - 12162' Open - Frontier
12190' - 12192' Open - Frontier

12308' - 12310' Open - Frontier
12360'-12362' Open - Frontier
12378' - 12380' Open - Frontier
12486' - 12488' Open - Frontier
12494'- 12496' Frac w/ 39,962 Lbs in 148,134 Gals Open - Frontier
12521'- 12523' Open - Frontier
12576' - 12578' Open - Dakota
12604'- 12606' Open - Dakota

12762'- 12766' Open - Dakota
12788'- 12794' Open - Dakota
12870' - 12874' Open - Dakota
12884'- 12888' Open - Dakota
12900'-12910' Frac w/ 128,600 Lbs in 84,126 Gals Open - Dakota
12950'-12960' Open - Dakota
12986'- 12990' Open - Dakota
13000'- 13004' Open - Dakota
13038' - 13040' Open -



UTOB796P17
FIELD: Undesignated GL: 5,082 · KBE: 5,099 ' Soud Date: 8-30-2007Completiondate: 2/1/08

Weli: NBZ 8D 318 24 TD: 13,210 • PETD: 13 707 CurrentWell Status: FlowingGas Well
Location- surface: SE/NESec. 31, TSS,R24E 1581' FNL,1233' FWL Reasonfor Pull/Workover: Inillaicompletion
Location - bottom hole: Same
API# 43-047- 37238 Uintah County,Utah Deviation:

Weilbom
Sciuunauc TuMna Landine Delali:

Description Size Footage Depth
KB 17.00 17.00

Surface casing
Size: 9.625"
Weight 36#
Grade: 1-55
Set @ 2225'
Cmtdw/ 650 sxs
Holesize: 12.25"

TuMna Information:
Condition:
New: Used: Rerun:
Grade:

EXISTINGPERFS Weight(#lit):

Weilhead Detail: Example: 7-1/16" 3000#
Wasatch 4-1/16" 10,000#
4924-28' w/ 3 spf
4938 w/ 3 spf
517943 w/ 3 spf Other:
5212-16 w/3spf Hanger: Yes No x
5232-34 w/ 3 spf

SUMMARY
Wasatch Stage#1- 12,762' - 13,040' Dakota - Frac w/ 5,038 100 mesh&5513-15' w/ 3 spf 123,562# 20/40 sand
5726-34' w/ 3 spf Staae #2 -12,606'

- 12,308' Dakota/Frontier- Frac w/ 39,962# 30/60 sd
Stage #3 - 11,964' - 12,192' Frontier - Frac w/ 40,085# 30/60 sd
Stage #4 - 11,564' - 11,822' Frontier/Manos - Frac w/ 39,901# 30/60 sd
Stage #5 - 11,096' - 11,375' Mancos - Frac w/ 40,300# 30/60 Sd
Stage #6- 10,716' - 10,970' Frontier/Mancos- Frac w/39,800# 30/60 sd

Blackhawk Stage #7 - 10,304' - 10,582' Mancos,/Mancos'B'/Frontier
8813-15 w/ 3 spf Frac w/ 40,000# 30/60 sd
88594il w/ 3 spf Stage #8 - 9,150' - 9,484' Mancos 'B' - Frac w/ 40,4494 30/60 sd8922-30 w/ 3 spf Slage #9 - 8,813' - 8,996' BlackhawkFrac w/ 82,001# 20/40 PRCInterinediate Casing 89tW2 w/ 3spf Stage #10 - 5,513' - 5,734"Wasatch - Frac w/ 51,026# 20/40 PRCSize: 7" 899+96 w/3 sof Stage #11 - 4,924' - 5,234' Wasatch Frac w/ 48,211# 30/60 sdWelcht: 26#

Grade: HCP-110 Nancos W
Set @ 8800 9150 54 w/ 3 sof
Cmtdw/ 1260 Sxs 9390-92 w/ 3 spf
Hole size: 8.75" 9422-24 w/ 3 sof

9434-36 w/ 3 spf
9456-60 w/ 3 spf
9482-84 w/ 3 spf

Mancos/Frontier
1030+06' wf 3 spf
10368-70' w/ 3 spf
10426-28' w/ 3 spf

Production Casina 10460-62· w/ 3 sof
Size: 4-1/2" 10488-90' w/ 3 sof
Weight: 15.1# 10510-12' w/ 3 spf
Grade: P-110 10542-44' wi3ser
Set @ 70' 10580-82' wi 3 sof

Size: 4-1/2"
Weight: 13.5# Mancom/Fronder
Grade: P-110 1071tr18" wi 3 spfSet @ 70'-12,579' 10730-32' w/ 3 sof

10742-44' w/ 3 spfSize: 4-1/2 10789-91' wl 3 set
Weight: 15.1# 10848-50' w/ 3 sofGrade: P-110 10878-80' w/ 3 sofSet 0 12,579'-13,204 1094143" wl 3 spf

I Cmtdw/ 850 sxs 10968-70 w/ 3 spfHolesize: 6.125"

Mancos
11096-98 w/ 3 spf
11114-16 w/ 3 spf
11164-6& w/ 3 spf
1119Œ92' w/ 3 spf
1126446' w/ 3 spf
1127+76 w/ 3 spf
11343-45' w/ 3 spf
11373-75' w/ 3 spf

Mancos/Fronder
1156446' w/3spf
11582-84' w/ 3 spf
11598-00' w/ 3 spf
11636-38' w/ 3 spf
11703-05' w/ 3 spf
11756-58' w¡ 3 spf
11780-82' w/ 3 spf
11820-22' w/ 3 spf

Fronder
1196‡Æ6 w/ 3 spf
12002-04 w/ 3 spf
12030-32 wt 3 spf
12052-54 w/ 3 spf
12106-08 w/ 3 spf
1214446 w/ 3 spf
1216042 w/ 3 spf
12190-92 w/ 3 spf

Fronder/Dakote
12308-10 w/ 3 spf
1236042 wt 3 spf
12378-80 w/ 3 spf
12486-88 w/ 3 spf
12494-96 w/ 3 spf
12521-23 w/ 3 spf
12576-78' w/ 3 spf
1260‡Ð6' w/ 3 Spf

Ë Dakota
Ë 1276246' w/ 3 spf

EXCLUDEDPERFS i 12788-94' w/3sof
i 12870-74' w/ 3 spf

12884-88' w/ 3 spf
12900-10' w/ 3 spf
12950 w/ 3 spf
1298&BD w/3spf
13000-04 w/ 3 spf
3038-40 w/ 3

Revised ByDahn Caldwell 4/1/2008
Prepared By: Ann Petrik Date: 2/22/08



Questar E & P Page 1 of 2

'M b 24e Operations Summary Report

Well Name:NBZ 8D-31-8-24 8¥-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

1/24/2008 07:00 -19:45 12.75 PERF 2 MIRU OWP ELU. RIH with Guns check depths withlogs made l'correction . Get on
depth & shoot 1ST set from 13,040' to 12,950'POOH. RBIH 2nd set of guns shoot
from 12.888' to 12,762' perfstage #1. Pressure out of the hole 0 psi. Drain tree and fill
with methanol. MIRU HES frac equipment, finish fillingmountain movers and heat frac
water. Prep to start frac operation in morning. SDFN.

1/25/2008 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 STIM 2 MIRU HES frac equipment,spent most of the day riging up equip. Priming up equip
,pump a 1" stop shut parting 4"treating line apart. SDFD

1/26/2008 10:30 - 17:00 6.50 STIM 2 MIRU HES frac equipment, RD 4" 10,000 psi frac line . RU 3 - 3" 15,000 psi frac lines.
Pressure test lines with brine . Prep for frac on SUNDAY.

1/27/2008 06:00 -09:50 3.83 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #1 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS 15% HCL WITH 2,003 BBLS
HYBOR-G X/LINKCARRING 5,038 LBS 100 MESH & 123,562 LBS 20/40
SINTERLITE FROM i TO 4 PPA. AVERAGE PRESSURE = 7,560 PSI, AVERAGE
RATE = 45 BPM.

10:00 -13:10 3.17 PERF 2 RU OWP ELU. #2 MU RIH WITH 8 GUNS LOADED 3 SPF, 11 GR CHARGE AND
120* PHASE.SET CFP @ 12,620 SHOOT 24 HOLES FROM 12,606' TO 12,308'.
5,500 PSI WHEN GUNS WERE FIRED AND 5,000 PSI WITH GUNS ON THE
SURFACE.

13:10 -15:10 2.00 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #2 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS 15% HCL WITH 3,527 BBLS
SUCK WATER CARRING 39,962 LBS 30/60 SINTERLITE FROM .2 TO .75 PPA.
AVERAGE PRESSURE = 8,260 PSI, AVERAGE RATE = 45 BPM.

15:10 -17:30 2.33 STIM 3 RU OWP ELU. #3 MU RIH WITH 8 GUNS LOADED3 SPF, 11 GR CHARGE AND
120* PHASE.SET CFP @ 12,220' SHOOT 24 HOLES FROM 11,964' TO 12,192'.
6,200 PSI WHEN GUNS WERE FIRED AND 5,600 PSI WITH GUNS ON THE
SURFACE.

1/28/2008 06:00 -09:25 3.42 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #3 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS 15% HCL WITH 3,371 BBLS
SLICK WATER CARRING 40,085 LBS 30/60 SINTERLITE FROM .2 TO .75 PPA.
AVERAGE PRESSURE = 7,850 PSI, AVERAGE RATE = 40BPM.

09:30-11:15 1.75 PERF 2 RU OWP ELU.#4 MU RIH WITH 8 GUNS LOADED 3 SPF, 11 GR CHARGE AND
120* PHASE.SET CFP @ 11,850' SHOOT 24 HOLES FROM 11,564' TO 11,822'.
5,700 PSI WHEN GUNGWERE FIRED AND 5,600 PSI WITH GUNS ON THE
SURFACE.

12:04-13:10 1.10 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #4 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS 15% HCL WITH 3,375 BBLS
SLICK WATER CARRING 39,901 LBS 30/60 SINTERLITE FROM .2 TO .75 PPA.
AVERAGE PRESSURE = 4230 PSt, AVERAGE RATE = 45 BPM.

13:10 -14:30 1.33 PERF 2 RU OWP ELU. #5 MU R1HWITH 8 GUNS LOADED 3 SPF, 11 GR CHARGE AND
120* PHASE.SET CFP @ 11,400' SHOOT 24 HOLES FROM 11,096' TO 11,375'.
5,700 PSI WHEN GUNS WERE FIRED AND 5,400 PSI WITH GUNS ON THE
SURFACE.

14:55-17:45 2.83 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE#5 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS15% HCL WITH 3,438 BBLS
SLICK WATER CARRING 40,300 LBS 30/60 SINTERLITE FROM .2 TO .75 PPA.
AVERAGE PRESSURE = 6,940 PSI, AVERAGE RATE = 44.6 BPM.

18:00 -20:00 2.00 PERF 2 RU OWP ELU. #6 MU RIH WITH 8 GUNS LOADED 3 SPF, 11 GR CHARGE AND
120* PHASE.SET CFP @ 11,000' SHOOT 24 HOLES FROM 10,716' TO 10,970'.
5,200 PSI WHEN GUNS WERE FIRED AND 5,600 PSI WITH GUNS ON THE
SURFACE.

1/29/2008 06:00-09:25 3.42 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE#6 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS 15% HCL WITH 3,339 BBLS
SLICK WATER CARRING 39,800 LBS 30/60 SINTERLITE FROM .2 TO .75 PPA.
AVERAGE PRESSURE = 9,130 PSI, AVERAGE RATE = 35 BPM.

09:30-11:15 1.75 PERF 2 RU OWP ELU.#7 MU RIH WITH 8 GUNS LOADED 3 SPF, 11 GR CHARGE AND
120* PHASE.SET CFP @10,615' SHOOT 24 HOLES FROM 10,304' TO 10,582'.
5,000 PSI WHEN GUNS WERE FIRED AND 4,800 PSI WITH GUNS ON THE
SURFACE.

Printed: 4/17/2008 12:10:14



Questar E & P Page 2 of 2

Operations Summary Report

Well Name:NBZ 8D-31-8-24 ST-2 Spud Date: 8/31/2007
Location: 31- 8-S 24-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

1/29/2008 12:05-18:10 6.08 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE#7 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS 15% HCL WITH 3,632 BBLS
SLICK WATER CARRING 40,000 LBS 30/60 SINTERLITE FROM .2 TO .75 PPA.
AVERAGE PRESSURE = 6,370 PSI, AVERAGE RATE = 48 BPM.

18:15 - 20:20 2.08 PERF 2 RU OWP ELU. #8 MU RlH WITH 6 GUNS LOADED 3 SPF, 11 GR CHARGE AND
120* PHASE.SET CBP @9,510' SHOOT 48 HOLES FROM 9,150' TO 9,484'. 3,900
PSI WHEN GUNS WERE FIRED AND 3,200 PSI WITH GUNS ON THE SURFACE.

1/30/2008 06:30 -08:40 2.17 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #8 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS 15% HCL WITH 3,425 BBLS
SLICK WATER CARRING 40,449 LBS 30/60 SINTERLITE FROM .2 TO .75 PPA.
AVERAGE PRESSURE = 4,610 PSI, AVERAGE RATE = 47 BPM.

08:45-10:35 1.83 PERF 2 RU OWP ELU. #9 MU RIH WITH 5 GUNS LOADED 3 SPF, 11 GR CHARGE AND
120* PHASE.SET CFP @9,020' SHOOT 16 HOLES FROM 8,813' TO 8,996'. 3,600
PSI WHEN GUNS WERE FIRED AND 3,500 PSI WITHGUNS ON THE SURFACE.

10:35-12:20 1.75 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE#9 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS 15% HCL WITH 2,391 BBLS
SLICK WATER CARRING 82,001 LBS 20/40 PRC FROM .5 TO 2 PPA. AVERAGE
PRESSURE = 5,500 PSI, AVERAGE RATE = 47 BPM.

12:20 -13:30 1.17 PERF 2 RU OWP ELU.#10 MU RlH WITH 8 GUNS LOADED 3 SPF, 11 GR CHARGE AND
120* PHASE.SET CFP @5,760' SHOOT 10 HOLES FROM 5,513' TO 5,734'. 4,000
PSI WHEN GUNS WERE FIRED AND 3,700 PSI WITH GUNS ON THE SURFACE.

13:30 -14:35 1.08 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #10 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS 15% HCL WITH 561 BBLS
SLICK WATER CARRING 51,026 LBS 20/40 PRC FROM 1PPA TO 5 PPA.
AVERAGE PRESSURE = 5,600 PSI, AVERAGE RATE = 31 BPM.

14:45 -15:45 1.00 PERF 2 RU OWP ELU. #11 MU RIH WITH 5 GUNS LOADED 3 SPF, 11 GR CHARGEAND
120* PHASE.SET CFP @5,260' SHOOT 16 HOLES FROM 4,924' TO 5,234'. 3,800
PSI WHEN GUNS WERE FIRED AND 3,800 PSI WITH GUNS ON THE SURFACE.

15:45-16:30 0.75 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE#11 BREAK DOWN FLUID 19 BBLS 15% HCL WITH 567 BBLS
SLICK WATER CARRING 48,211 LBS 30/60 SINTERLITE FROM .2 TO .75 PPA.
AVERAGE PRESSURE = 4,000 PSI, AVERAGE RATE= 42 BPM.

1/31/2008 07:00 -18:00 11.00 WHD 2 MIRU IPS CTU, Parchman GCDOE, Spirit fluids and Express 2.875" motor and
3.625" 5 Blade junkmin. SDFN Start in moming.

2/1/2008 07:00 -18:00 11.00 TRP 9 QEP repaired leak in Pro-Pack and tested. Load CT with 150* F water.MU Express 2
7/8" motorljars with 3.625" 5-blade junkmill.Test stack to8,000 psi. Attempt to RIH
but tagged up in flowcross. MIRU second crane. ND flow cross. Upon inspection,
found the Stinger 4 1/16" 10K X 4 1/16" 15K crossover ID was not full bore. Changed
out crossover and NU. Re-test stack to 8,000 psi. RIH and drill out 10 plugs in 10
hours to FC depth of 13,202'. Pump final sweep and POOH (OOH @06:00 this
morning. Noted pin hole in coil at 5,500'). Prep to RDMO OTDOE. IPS flowing well to
sales: FCP - 2,600 psi, 34/64" choke, 2.0 MMCFIDgas, 120 BWPH and light sand.

2/2/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 PTST 2 FLOWING TO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT.
2/3/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 PTST 2 FLOWING TO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT.
2/4/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 PTST 2 FLOWING TO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT.
2/5/2008 06:00-06:00 24.00 PTST 2 COSTUPDATE

Printed: 4/17/2008 12:10:14



Fonn 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR E

irŠ$ch311

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTv773oi

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

Big Valley Unit1. Type of 11
OilWell GasWell Other 8. WellNameandNo.

2. NameofOpemtor .

NBZ8D-31-8-24
QEP Uintah Basm Inc 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo. (inchide area code) 43-047-37238

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 435-781-4319 10.FieldandPool,or ExploratoryArea
4. LocationofWell (Footage,Sec.,T.,R.,M, orSroveyDescription)

1581' FNL, 1233' FEL, SENE, SECTION 31, TSS, R24E, SLBM l1. CountyorParish, State

Uintah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NDIIŒ, REPORT, OR GIHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Production(Statt/Resume) Water Shut-Off
Noticeof Intent AlterCasing FractureTreat Reclamation WellIntegrity

SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other
ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporarilyAbandon

FinalAbandonmentNotice Convertto Injection PlugBack WaterDisposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearlystateall pertinentdetails,includingestimated startingdateofanyproposedwork andapproximate durationthereof
Iftheproposalistodeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasuredandtrueverticaldepthsof allpertinentmarkersand zones.
AttachtheBondunder which thework will beperformedorprovidetheBondNo. onfilewith BLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequentreportsshallbe filedwithin30days
followingcompletionoftheinvolvedoperations.Iftheoperationresultsina multiplecompletion or recompletion ina new interval,a Form31604 shall be filedonce
testinghasbeencompleted.FinalAbandonmentNoticesshallbe filedonlyafterall requirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted,andtheoperatorhas
determinedthatthesite isready forfinalinspection.)

The operator requests approval to isolate water in this well by squeezing cement through a retainer and into perforations at 4924'-28' and
4938'-40'. The cement will be drilled out shortly after and well will be returned to production.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

oute:/O*23•2Dog

initials:

14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Signature

ra mcgilliv qu tar.com TitateePetr m Eng

Approvedby

CE EDERAL OR STA EO E USE

Date |Ô 20
Conditionsof approval,if any,are attached.Approvalof thisnotice doesnotwarrantor gg S
certify thatthe applicant holdslegalor equitable titleto thoserights inthe subjectlease Office
which wouldentitle the applicant to conduct operationsthereon. ActionisNecessary
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crime for any personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsasto anymatterwithin its jurisdiction.
(Instructionson page 2) RECEIVED

OCT16 2008
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT TAKE Pator"

H 3 Utah State Office "AM ER ICA

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.bim.govlut/stlen.html

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

May 25, 2010

Birgit Roesink-Miller
Questar Exploration & Production Co.
1050 17thStreet, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265

Re: Initial Consolidated Wasatch-Mesaverde-
Mancos-Dakota Formation PA
Big Valley Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Dear Mrs. Roesink-Miller:

The Initial Consolidated Wasatch-Mesaverde-Mancos-Dakota Formation PA, Big Valley Unit, CRS
No. UTU81308C, is hereby approved effective as of December 1, 2006, pursuant to Section 11 of
the Big Valley Unit Agreement, Uintah County, Utah.

The Initial Consolidated Wasatch-Mesaverde-Mancos-Dakota Formation PA results in an initial
consolidated participating area of 3,780.63 acres and is based upon the completion of the following
wells as capable of producing unitized substances in paying quantities.

WELL NO. API NO. LOCATION LEASE NO.
RWS 16ML-6-9-24 43-047-37335 SE¼SE¼, 06-9S-24E UTU73456
RWS 2ML-5-9-24 43-047-37306 NW¼NE¼, 05-9S-24E UTU73456
RWS 12ML-6-9-24 43-047-37312 NW¼SW¼, 06-9S-24E UTU73456
RWS 4ML-5-9924 43-047-37351 NW¼NW¼, 05-98-24E UTU73456
RWS 4ML-6-9-24 43-047-37412 NW¼NW¼, 06-98-24E UTU73456
RWS 8D-6-9-24 43-047-37352 SE¼NE¼, 06-98-24E UTU73456
RWS 6D-5-9-24 43-047-37350 SE¼NW¼, 05-9S-24E UTU73456
RWS 6D-6-9-24 43-047-37413 SE¼NW¼, 06-98-24E UTU73456
NBZ 8D-31-8-24 43-047-37238 SE¼NE¼, 31-8S-24E UTU77301
CWD 10D-32-8-24 43-047-37347 NW¼SE¼, 32-88-24E UTU78029
CWD 14D-32-8-24 43-047-37277 SE¼SW¼, 32-88-24E UTU78029

RECElVED
JUN072010

OlU ftC All 12AO9.



The following wells not capable of producing unitized substances in paying quantities will be
included in the InitialConsolidated Wasatch-Mesaverde-Mancos-Dakota Formation PA pursuant to
Section 11 of the unit agreement as necessary for unit operations.

WELL NO. API NO. LOCATION LEASE NO.
RWS 10ML-5-9-24 43-047-37308 NW¼SE¼, 05-9S-24E UTU73456
RWS 14D-5-9-24 43-047-37310 SE¼SW¼, 05-9S-24E UTU73456
RWS 14D-6-9-24 43-047-37414 SE¼SW¼, 06-98-24E UTU73456
NBZ 8ML-30-8-24 43-047-37231 SE¼NE¼, 30-8S-24E UTU77301
NBZ 13ML-29-8-24 43-047-37237 SW¼SW¼, 29-8S-24E UTU77301
CWD 16D-32-8-24 43-047-37278 SE¼SE¼, 32-88-24E UTU78029

Copies of the approved request are being distributed to the appropriate Federal agencies and one
copy is returned herewith. Please advise all interested parties of the approval of the Initial
Consolidated Wasatch-Mesaverde-Mancos-Dakota Formation PA, BigValley Unit, and the effective
date.

No action willbe taken at this timeto your request for the contraction of the Big Valley Unit as itwill
automatically contract June 16, 2010.

Sincerely,

/s/Roger L. Bankert

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals

Enclosure

bcc: UDOGM
SITLA
MMS - MRM w/enclosure (Attn: Leona Reilly)
FOM - Vernal w/enclosure
Unit file - Big Valley w/enclosure
Fluids - Mickey
Fluids - Judy F REC€lVED
Agr. Sec. Chron.
Reading File 2 JUÑ07 2Û1Û
Central Files

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: (,/14/2010

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit: BIG VALLEY
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Energy (Big Valley) FORM A.xls



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

See attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS I NDIA AcLLO EEORTRIBENAME:

7 UNIT or CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnew wells,significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, of t° See attacheddrill norizontallaterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1 TYPE OF WELL

8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OfL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER
See attached

2 NAMEÓF OPERATOR:
9. API NUMBER:Questar Exploration and Production Cornpany $$Ñ Attached

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver o g, CO z, 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: See attached couuTY: Attached
QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDŒE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATIONNOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PlANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENTOR FLARE
SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION{START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFFDate of wait completion:
COMM1NGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change
12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pedinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This namechange involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The sameemployees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. Alloperations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965666683
Fee Land Bond Number:
BIA Bond Number: 79944& QGŠ~0/O

(o 3
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As ofJune 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described onthe list

NAME(PLEASE P Morgan Anderson Regulatory AffairsAnalyst

SIGNATURg DATE 6/23/2010

(This space for State use only)

RECElVED APPROVEDÁ/g/2
JUN2 8 2010

(5/2000)

DIV,OFOIL,GAS&
MININËeeInstructions on Reverse Side)

ÜÎVÎSÎOHOf Oil,OasandMining'
EarleneRussell.Ennineerina



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
BIG VALLEY

eñectiveJune 14,2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

RWS 3ML-9-9-24 09 090S 240E 4304735483 15190 Federal GW S
RTVS10h4L-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304735653 17644 Federed (in? P
CWD 4ML-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304735684 17644 Federal GW S
NBZ 4D-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304737229 16630 Federal GW OPS C
NBZ 6ML-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304737230 16810 Federal GW OPS C
FEBZ8AIL-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304737231 17644 Federal (39V P
NBZ 10ML-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304737232 16695 ÈederalGW OPS C
f(BZ 1213-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304737233 16631 Federal (IVV CIPS C
FEBZ14hdL-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304737234 16696 Federal (ivV C)PS C
NBZ 6D-31-8-24 31 080S 240E 4304737235 16611 Federal GW OPS C
NBZ 4D-31-8-24 31 080S 240E 4304737236 16576 Federal GW OPS C
NBZ 13ML-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304737237 17644 Federal GW P
FEBZ813-31-8-24 31 080S 240E 4304737238 17644 Federal GNV P
NBZ 2ML-31-8-24 31 080S 240E 4304737239 17098 Federal GW OPS C
NBZ 11D-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304737240 16612 Federal GW OPS C
NBZ 5D-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304737241 16632 Federal GW OPS C
NBZ 9D-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304737244 15677 Federal GW OPS C
NBZ 15ML-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304737246 16697 Federal GW OPS C
CWD 3D-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304737274 16923 Federal GW OPS C
CWD 14ML-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304737277 17644 Federal GW P
CWD 16D-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304737278 17644 Federal GW P
RVVS2A41,5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304737306 17644 Federal (39V P
RWS 8D-5-9-24 05 I 090S 240E 4304737307 16614 Federal GW OPS C
RWS 10ML-5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304737308 17644 Federal GW S
1091812hfi,5-9-24 105 090S 240E 4304737309 17644 Federal (39V P
IUVVS1413-5-9-24 |05 090S 240E 4304737310 17644 Federal CivV P
ItWVS16A4Le5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304737311 16698 Federal (ITV C)PS C
RWS 12ML-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304737312 17644 Federal GW P
ItvVS16A4L,6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304737335 17644 Federed (39V P
CWD 10D-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304737347 17644 Federal GW P
RWS 6D-5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304737350 17644 Federal GW P
ItiVS4hdi,5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304737351 17644 Federal (ITV P
RTVS8D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304737352 17644 Federed CTW P
RWS 2D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304737411 17272 Federal GW OPS C
RWS 4ML-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304737412 17644 Federal GW S
RWS 6D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304737413 17644 Federal GW P
RWS 14D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304737414 17644 Federal GW P
RWS 5ML-9-9-24 09 090S 240E 4304738645 17273 Federal GW OPS C
RWS 12ML-9-9-24 09 090S 240E 4304738646 17274 Federal GW OPS C
NBZ 16D-31-8-24 31 080S 240E 4304739435 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 10D-31-8-24 31 080S 240E 4304739456 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 12D-31-8-24 31 080S 240E 4304739457 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 14D-31-8-24 31 080S 240E 4304739458 Federal GW APD C
CWD 13D-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304739464 Federal GW APD C
RWS 7D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304739494 Federal GW APD C
RWS 13D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304739495 Federal GW APD C
RWS 11D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304739496 Federal GW APD C
RWS 9D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304739497 Federal GW APD C
RWS 3D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304739498 Federal GW APD C
RWS 15D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304739500 Federal GW APD C
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
BIG VALLEY

effective June 14, 2010
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RWS SD-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304739501 Federal GW APD C
RWS 7D-5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304739502 Federal GW APD C
RWS 11D-5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304739503 Federal GW APD C
RWS 9D-5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304739504 Federal GW APD C
RWS 13D-5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304739505 Federal GW APD C
RWS 15D-5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304739506 Federal GW APD C
RWS 3D-5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304739507 Federal GW APD C
RWS 1D-5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304739508 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 5D-31-8-24 31 080S 240E 4304739511 Federal GW APD C
CWD llD-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304739535 Federal GW APD C
CWD 15D-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304739536 Federal GW APD C
RWS 5D-5-9-24 05 090S 240E 4304739673 Federal GW APD C
RWS 1D-6-9-24 06 090S 240E 4304739674 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 3D-31-8-24 31 080S 240E 4304739675 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 16D-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304740355 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 15D-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304740356 Federal GW APD C
CWD 6D-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304740357 Federal GW APD C
CWD 2D-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304740358 Federal GW APD C
CWD 5D-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304740359 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 10D-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304740360 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 8D-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304740361 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 14D-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304740362 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 16D-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304740363 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 12D-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304740364 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 13D-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304740365 Federal GW APD C
RWS 4D-9-9-24 09 090S 240E 4304740470 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 9D-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304740471 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 11D-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304740472 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 7D-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304740473 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 2D-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304740476 Federal GW APD C
CWD 7D-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304740477 Federal GW APD C
CWD 9D-32-8-24 32 080S 240E 4304740478 Federal GW APD C
RWS 6D-9-9-24 09 090S 240E 4304740479 Federal GW APD C
RWS 13D-9-9-24 09 090S 240E 4304740480 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 6D-29-8-24 29 080S 240E 4304740483 Federal GW APD C
NBZ ID-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304740484 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 20-30-8-24 30 080S 240E 4304740485 Federal GW APD C
NBZ 3D-30-8-24

, 30 080S 240E 4304740486 Federal GW APD C
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'a United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PRtoE'+4

H 35/ Utah State Office INAM ERICAP.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

http://www.b1m.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL 2 8 2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

1FieldhOffice PriaceFie ce Moa Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Eastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS
UDOGM

RECE ED
AUS16
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