| 300 E. Mineral Ave., Suite 10
B& A Littleton, CO 80122-2631
303/781-8211 303/781-1167 Fax

Environmental Consultants

July 8, 20035

Fluid Minerals Group
Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office

170 South 500 East

Vernal, Utah 84078

RE: Application for Permit to Drill~-Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc.

LCU 11-9H, 2,229 FSL & 1,989' FWL, NE/4 SW/4,
Section 9, T11S, R20E, SLB&M, Uintah County, Utah

Dear Fluid Minerals Group:
On behalf of Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc. (Dominion), Buys & Associates, Inc. respectfully sub-
mits the enclosed original and two copies of the Application for Permit to Drill (APD) for the above referenced
well, Included with the APD is the following supplemental information:

Exhibit “A” - Survey plats, layouts and photos of the proposed well site;

Exhibit “B” - Proposed location maps with access and utility corridors;

Exhibit “C” - Production site layout;

Exhibit “D” - Drilling Plan;

Exhibit “E” - Surface Use Plan;

Exhibit “F” - Typical BOP and Choke Manifold diagram.

Please accept this letter as Dominion’s, written request for confidential treatment of all information contained in
and pertaining to this application.

Thank you very much for your timely consideration of this application. Please feel free to contact myself or
Carla Christian of Dominion at 405-749-5263 if you have any questions or need additional information.

Sincerely,

Don Hamilton i
Agent for Dominion e ’ﬁE\\J ED
cc: Diana Whitney, Division of Qil, Gas and Mining j’dL 13 ?-““5

Carla Christian, Dominion HINING
Marty Buys, Buys & Associates, Inc. e A8 KNS
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Form 3160-3 SUBMIT IN TRLGRICATE* Form approved.
(December 1990) ![) (Other instructions Budget Burean No. 1004-0136
STATES reverse side) W8 Expires: December 31, 1991
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-76265
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN © IF INDIAR, ALLOTTER OR TRIRE NAME
la. TYPE OF WORK ”MY;U A&MWPW
DRILL Kl DEEPEN 1 . .
b. TYPE OF WELL Little Canyon Unit
oL GAS SINGLE MULTIPLE 8. FARM QR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.
wie [} we, [} ommr ZONE Kl ZONE a LCU 11-9H
7 NAME OF OPERATOR VAMWHINO
Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc. H43-047-3L Y a6

3. ADDRESS AND TELEPHONE NO.

14000 Quail Springs Parkway. Suite 600, Oklahoma City, OK 73134, 405- 749-5263

10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

| ~NotoratButtes Lnpkt S uate

4wamleMmexmm"mmmmmq LF' ZLJ’VX 5[? (‘773 —7¢i\q ll..‘SEEf.T.,lM.ORBIK.‘
> i 27229 FSL & 1989 FWL.NEA SWA, 4y 5,9y - Section 9,
o 229" FSL & 1,989’ FWL, NE/4 SW/4, M.L85532Z-]  T1i1S R20E SLB&M

T4, DISTANCE N MELES. AND DERECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE®

[2. COUNTY OR PARISH £3. STATE

14.85 miles south of Ouray, Utah Uintah Utsh
15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED* 6. NO. OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSMGNED
LOCATION TOQ NEAREST TO THES WELL
PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(Algo to nearest drig. unit line, if any) 4007 1 ’040 40 acres
18, DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED 19. PROPOSED DEFTH 20, ROTARY OR CABLF TOOR.S
LA ATION TO NEAREST WELL, j
DRILEING, COMPLETED, Ok |
APPLIED FOR. ON THES LEASEFT. None 3, 550° Rotary
21, ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF RT,GR, etc.) 72 APPROX. DATE WORK WILL STAKT*
5.164" GR August 15. 2005
b3 PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE GRADE, SIZE OF CASING WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEFTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT
12-1/4 8-5/8" J-55 ST&C 324 2,000 252 sks Lead, 219 sks, tail, 100 sks top ovm—see attached Drilling Plan
1-H8 5-12" Mav 80 LT&C 174 8.550° 160 sks Lead, 435 sks Tail—see attached Drilling Pian

Bond Information:

Bond coverage is provided by Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America, Bond #768 63050 0330

Other Information:
Drilling Plan and Surface Use Plan are attached.
Dominion requests that this complete application for permit to drill be held confidential.
A request for exception to spacing (R649-3-2) is hereby requested based on topography

since the well is located

within 460’ of the drilling unit boundary. Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc. is the only owner and

operator within 460 of the proposed well.

Jal of this

peders! A0 PO s Ak |3 205

N;tloﬂ

DIV OF OlL, GAS & MINING

DE@EHWED‘

CONFIDENTIAL

IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM: If proposal is to deepen, give data present productive zone and proposed new productive zone. 1 proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give

peninem data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout preventer program, if any.

__ sioNED M Mk%ﬂ- Don Hamilton g Agent for Dominion DATE

July 8, 2005
(nmmeﬁrmesmmtml o —
PERMIT NO. 43 b"l’?' 3(1% APFROVAL DATE

Applﬂmna%mﬂ&nxmwm the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the sobject lkease which wosld entithe the applicast o couduct operats

CONINTIENS /

BRADLEY G. HILL
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1, makes

Title 18 US.C. Section 100 it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency or the
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= =t " SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:
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_I___ LONGITUDE = 109°41'10.69" (109.686303) Pm: = 1000 3-31-05 5-02-05
= 90" SYMBOL (NAD 27) AF. T.C. LK REFERE;NEES PLAT
@ - PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE = 39°52'25.18" (39.873661) T — ST —
A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE = 109'41°08.20" (109.685611) COOL DOMINION EXPLR. & PROD., INC

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS iS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

(NAD 83)

DOMINION EXPLR. & PROD., INC.

Well location, LCU #11-8H, located as shown in

the NE 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section 9, TI1S, R20E,
S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah.

BASIS OF ELEVATION

SPOT ELEVATION LOCATED AT THE SOUTHWEST CORNER OF
SECTION 20, T10S, R20E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE BIG
PACK MTN. NW, QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY 7.5
MINUTE QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL
SURVEY. SAID ELEVATION |S MARKED AS BEING 5251 FEET.
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DRILLING PLAN
APPROVAL OF OPERATIONS
Attachment for Permit to Drill
Name of Operator: Dominion Exploration & Production
Address: 14000 Quail Springs Parkway, Suite 600
Oklahoma City, OK 73134
Well Location: LCU J1-9H

21227 FSL & 1965 FWL
Section 9-115-20FE
Uintah County, UT

1.  GEOLOGIC SURFACE FORMATION Uintah

2. ESTIMATED DEPTHS OF IMPORTANT GEOLOGIC MARKERS

Formation Depth
Wasatch Tongue 3.130°
Green River Tongue 3.460°
Wasatch 3.600°
Chapita Wells 4.450°
Uteland Buttes 5,590’
Mesaverde 6,360°

3. ESTIMATED DEPTHS OF ANTICIPATED WATER. OIL. GAS OR MINERALS

Formation Depth Type
Wasatch Tongue 3.130° Oil
Green River Tongue 3,460’ Oil
Wasatch 3.600° Gas
Chapita Wells 4.450° Gas
Uteland Buttes 5.590° Gas
Mesgaverde 6,360° Gas

4.  PROPOSED CASING PROGRAM

All casing used to drill this well will be new casing.

Type Size Weight Grade Conn. Top Bottom  Hole
Surface 8-5/8"  32.0 ppf J-55 STC 0 2,000 12-i/47
Production  5-1/2" 17.0ppf MAV-80 LTC 0 8,550 7-7/8”

Note: The drilled depth of the surface hole and the setting depth of the surface casing may vary from 1,700” to 2,000°.
Should a lost circulation zone be encountered while drilling, casing will be set approximately 300° below the lost
circulation zone. If no lost circulation zone is encountered, casing to be set at 2,000°+.

CONFIDENTIAL




DRILLING PLAN

APPROVAL OF OPERATIONS

OPERATOR’S MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONS FOR PRESSURE CONTROL

Surface hole: No BOPE will be utilized. Air foam mist, rotating head and diverter system will be utilized.

Production hole: Prior to drilling out the surface casing shoe, 3,000 psi or greater BOP equipment will be installed. The
pipe rams will be operated at least once per day from intermediate casing to total depth. The blind rams will be tested once
per day from intermediate casing to total depth if operations permit.

A diagram of the planned BOP equipment for normal drilling operations in this area is attached, As denoted there will be
two valves and one check valve on the kill line, two valves on the choke line, and two adjustable chokes on the manifold
system. The BOP “stack” will consist of two BOP rams (1 pipe, 1 blind) and one annular type preventer, all ratedto a
minimum of 3,000 psi working pressure.

The BOP equipment will be pressure tested prior to drilling below the intermediate casing shoe. All test pressures will be
maintained for fifteen (15) minutes without any significant pressure decrease. Clear water will be circulated into the BOP
stack and lines prior to pressure testing. The following test pressures will be used as a minimum for various equipment
items.

Annular BOP 1,500 psi /

L.

2. Ram type BOP 3,000 psi
3. Kill line valves 3,000 psi
4.  Choke line valves and choke manifold valves 3,000 psi
5. Chokes 3,000 psi
6.  Casing, casinghead & weld 1,500 psi
7.  Upper kelly cock and safety valve 3,000 psi
8.  Dart valve 3,000 psi

MUD SYSTEMS

e An air or an air/mist system may be used to drill to drill the surface hole until water influx becomes t00 great.
» KCL mud system will be used to drill well.

Depths Mud Weight (ppg) Mud System
0 ~ 2,000 84 Air foam mist, rotating head and diverter
2.000° — 8,550° 8.6 Fresh water/2% KCL/KCL mud system
BLOOIE LINE

An automatic igniter will not be installed on blooie line. The blooie will have a contant ignition source.

A “target tee” connection will be installed on blooie line for 90° change of directions for abrasion resistance.
“Target tee” connections will be a minimum of 50° from wellhead.

The blooie line discharge will be a minimum of 100° from the wellhead.

AUXILIARY EQUIPMENT TO BE USED
a. Kelly cock.
b. Full opening valve with drill pipe connection will be kept on floor. Valve will be used when the kelly is not in string.

TESTING. LOGGING. AN CORING PROGRAMS TO BE FOLLOWED

e A drillstem test in the Wasatch Tongue is possible.

One electric line wire-log will be run from total depth to surface casing.

The gamma ray will be left on to record from total depth to surface casing.

Other log curves (resistivities, porosity, and caliper) will record from total depth to surface casing.
A dipmeter, percussion cores, or rotary cores may be run over selected intervals.

ANTICIPATED ABNORMAL PRESSURES OR TEMPERATURES EXPECTED
o Expected BHP 1,500~2,000 psi (lower than normal pressure gradient).

o No abnormal temperature or pressures are anticipated.

» The formations to be penetrated do not contain known H2S gas.

CONFIDENTIAL



DRILLING PLAN

APPROVAL OF OPERATIONS

11. WATER SUPPLY

No water pipelines will be laid for this well.

No water well will be drilled for this well.

Drilling water for this will be hauled on the road(s) shown in Attachment No. 3.

Water will be hauled from:  Water Permit # 43-10447 Section 9, Township § South, Range 20 East

12. CEMENT SYSTEMS

a, Surface Cement:
e Drill 12-1/4” hole to 2,000°+, run and cement 8-5/8” to surface (depth to vary based on depth of Jost circulation

zone).
o  Pump 20 bbls lightly weighted water spacer followed by 5 bbls fresh water. Displace with any available water.

Casing to be run with: a) guide shoe b) insert float c) three (3) centralizers, one on each of first 3 joints d) stop ring
for plug two joints off bottom &) bottom three joints thread locked f) pump job with bottom plug only.

e  Cement the casing annulus to surface. Top out jobs to be performed if needed. Depending to depth of top of
cement in the annulus, a 17 tubing string may or may not be utilized,

Hole Cemen
Type Sacks Interval Density Yield Volume Volume Excess
Lead 252 0°-1,500° 11.0ppg 3.82CFS8 619 CF 835CF 35%
Tail 219 1,500°-2,000 156ppg 118 CFS 220CF 297 CF 35%
Top Out 100 0°-200° 15.6 ppg 1.18 CFS 95 CF 118 CF 24% (if required)
Lead Mix:  Premium Plus V blend. Blend includes Class “G” cement, gel, salt, gilsonite.
Slurry yield: 3.82 effsack Slurry weight: 11.00 #/gal.
Water requirement: 22.95 gal/sack
Tail Mix: Class “G™ Cement, 1/4 Ib/sk Cellophane Flakes + 2% bwoc Calcium Chioride + 44.3% fresh water.
Slurry yield: 1.18 cf/sack Slurry weight: 15.60 #/gal.
Water requirement: 5.2 gal/sack
Top Out: Class “G” Cement, 1/4 1b/sk Cellophane Flakes + 2% bwoc Calcium Chloride + 44.3% fresh water.
Slurry yield: 1.18 cf/sack Slurry weight: 15.60 #/gal.
Water requirement: 5.2 gal/sack

¢. Production Casing Cement:

e  Drill 7-7/8" hole to 8,550°+, run and cement 5 1/2”,

e  Cement interface is at 4,000°, which is typically 500°-1,000” above shallowest pay.
s Pump 20 bbl Mud Clean I} unweighted spacer, followed by 20 Bbls fresh H20 spacer.
-

Displace with 3% KCL.
Hole Cement
Type Sacks Interval Density Yield Volume Volume Excess
Lead 160 3,700°—4,700° 11.5ppg  3.12CFS 175 CF 350CF 100%
Tail 435 4,700°-8,550 13.0 ppg 1.75 CFS 473 CF 946 CF 100%
Note: A caliper log will be ran to determine cement volume requirements.
Lead Mix:  Halliburton Prem Plus V blend. Blend includes Class “C” cement, gel, salt, gilsonite, EX-1 and HR-7.
Shurry yield: 3.12 cffsack Slurry weight: 11.60 #/gal.
Water requirement: 17.71 gal/sack
Compressives (@ 130°F: 157 psi after 24 hours
Tail Mix: Halliburton HLC blend (Prem Plus V/JB flyash). Blend includes Class “G” cement, KCl, EX-1, Halad 322,

& HR-5.

Slurry yield: 1.75 ct/sack

Water requirement: 9.09 gal/sack
Compressives (@ 165°F: 905 psi after 24 hours

Slarry weight: 13.00 #/gal.

13. ANTICIPATED STARTING DATE AND DURATION OF THE OPERATIONS

Starting Date:

Duration:

August 15, 2005
14 Days

CONFIDENTIAL




SURFACE USE PLAN
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
Attachment for Permit to Drill
Name of Operator: Dominion Exploration & Production
Address: 14000 Quail Springs Parkway, Suite 600
Oklahoma City, OK 73134
Well Location: LCU 11-9H

2122° FSL & 1965° FWL
Section 9-118-20E
Uintah County, UT

The dirt contractor will be provided with an approved copy of the surface use plan of operations
before initiating construction. !

The federal onsite inspection for the referenced well was conducted on'Friday, May 20, 2005 at approximately
3:30 pm. In attendance at the onsite inspection were the following individuals:

Ken Secrest Foreman Dominion E & P, Inc.

John Floyd Surveyor Uintah Engineering and Land Surveying

Stan Olmstead Nat. Res. Prot. Spec. Bureau of Land Management — Vernal

Karl Wright Nat. Res. Prot. Spec. Bureau of Land Management — Vernal

Amy Torres Biologist Bureau of Land Management — Vernal
1. Existing Roads:

a. The proposed well site is located approximately 14.85 miles south of Ouray, UT.

b. Directions to the proposed well site have been attached at the end of Exhibit B.

c. The use of roads under State and County Road Department maintenance are necessary to

access the Little Canyon Unit. However, an encroachment permit is not anticipated since no
upgrades to the State or County Road system are proposed at this time.

d. All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all phases of operation.

e. Vehicle operators will obey posted speed restrictions and observe safe speeds commensurate
with road and weather conditions.

f. Since no improvements are anticipated to the State, County, Tribal or BLM access roads no
topsoil striping will occur.

g. An off-lease federal Right-of-Way is not anticipated for the access road or utility corridor
since both are located within the existing Little Canyon Unit boundary.,



Planned Access Roads:

a. From the proposed LCU 15-9H access road an access is proposed trending east
approximately 0.1 miles to the proposed well site. The access consists of entirely new
disturbance and crosses no significant drainages. A road design plan is not anticipated at

this time.
b. The proposed access road will consist of a 14’ travel surface within a 30’ disturbed area.
c. BLM approval to construct and utilize the proposed access road is requested with this
application.
d. A maximum grade of 10% will be maintained throughout the project with minor cuts and fills

required to access the well.

e. No turnouts are proposed since the access road is only 0.1 miles long and adequate site
distance exists in all directions.

f. No culverts or low water crossings are anticipated. Adequate drainage structures will be
incorporated into the road.

g No surfacing material will come from federal or Indian lands.

h. No gates or cattle guards are anticipated at this time.

i. Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the approved location access road.
i All access roads and surface disturbing activities will conform to the standards outlined in the

Bureau of Land Management and Forest Service publication: Surface Operating Standards
for Oil and Gas Exploration and Development, (1989).

k. The operator will be responsible for all maintenance of the access road including drainage
structures.

Location of Existing Wells:

a. Exhibit B has a map reflecting these wells within a one mile radius of the proposed well.

Location of Production Facilities:

a. All permanent structures will be painted a flat, non-reflective Desert Brown to match the
standard environmental colors. All facilities will be painted within six months of installation.
Facilities required to comply with the Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) may be

excluded. :

b. Site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3163.7-5 and Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 3
will be adhered to.

c. A gas meter run will be constructed and located on lease within 500 feet of the welthead.

Meter runs will be housed and/or fenced. All gas production and measurement shall comply
with the provisions of 43 CFR 3162, 7-3, Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 5, and American
Gas Association (AGA) Report No. 3.



d. A tank battery will be constructed on this lease, it will be surrounded by a dike of sufficient
capacity to contain the storage capacity of the largest tank. All loading lines and valves will
be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery. Allliquid hydrocarbons production
and measurement shall conform to the provisions of 43 CFR 3162.7-3 and Onshore Oil and
Gas Order No. 4 and Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas production and

measurement.
€. Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife and livestock entry.
f. All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and accommodate year-

round traffic. The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

g. The site will require periodic maintenance to ensure that drainages are kept open and free of
debris, ice, and snow, and that surfaces are properly treated to reduce erosion, fugitive dust,
and impacts to adjacent areas.

h. A gas pipeline is associated with this application and is being applied for at this time. The
proposed gas pipeline corridor will leave the northwest side of the well site and traverse
1,914 west to the proposed 6” pipeline corridor that will service the LCU 16-9H.

i The new gas pipeline will be a 6” steel surface line within a 20° wide utility corridor. The
use of the proposed well site and access roads will facilitate the staging of the pipeline
construction. A new pipeline length of approximately 1,914’ is associated with this well.

- Dominion intends on installing the pipeline on the surface by welding many joints into long
lengths, dragging the long lengths into position and then completing a final welding pass to
join the long lengths together. Dominion intends on connecting the pipeline together utilizing
conventional welding technology.

Location and Type of Water Supply:

a, The location and type of water supply has been addressed as number 11 within the previous
drilling plan information.

Source of Construction Material:

a. The use of materials will conform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.
b. No construction materials will be removed from Ute Tribal or BLM lands.
<. If any gravel is used, it will be obtained from a state approved gravel pit.

Methods of Handling Waste Disposal:

a. All wastes associated with this application will be contained and disposed of utilizing
approved facilities.

b. Drill cuttings will be contained and buried on site.
c. The reserve pit will be located outboard of the location and along the northeast side of the
pad.

d. The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow any discharge.




The reserve pit will be lined with 12 mil minimum thickness plastic nylon reinforced liner
material, The liner will overlay a felt liner pad only if rock is encountered during excavation.
The pit liner will overlap the pit walls and be covered with dirt and/or rocks to hold it in
place. No trash, scrap pipe, etc., that could puncture the liner will be disposed of in the pit.
Pit walls will be sloped no greater than 2:1, A minimum 2-foot freeboard will be maintained
in the pit at all times during the drilling and completion operation.

The reserve pit has been located in cut material. Three sides of the reserve pit will be fenced
before drilling starts. The fourth side will be fenced as soon as drilling is completed, and
shall remain until the pit is dry. After the reserve pit has dried, all areas not needed for
production will be rehabilitated.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title 111 (hazardous materials) in an amount
greater than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of
annually in association with the drilling, testing, or completion of the well. Furthermore, no
extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling,
testing, or completion of the well.

Trash will be contained in a trash cage and hauled away to an approved disposal site as
necessary but no later than at the completion of drilling operations. The contents of the trash
container will be hauled off periodically to the approved Uintah County Landfill near Vernal,
Utah,

Produced fluids from the well other than water will be produced into a test tank until such
time as construction of production facilities is completed. Any spills of oil, gas, salt water or
other produced fluids will be cleaned up and removed.

After initial clean-up, a 400 bbl tank will be installed to contain produced waste water. This
water will be transported from the tank to an approved Dominion disposal well for disposal.

Produced water from the preduction well will be disposed of at the RBU 13-11F or
RBU 16-19F disposal wells in accordance with Onshore Order #7.

Any salts and/or chemicals, which are an integral part of the drilling system, will be disposed
of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

Sanitary facilities will be on site at all times during operations., Sewage will be placed ina
portable chemical toilet and the toilet replaced periodically utilizing a licensed contractor to
transport by truck the portable chemical toilet so that its contents can be delivered to the
Vernal Wastewater Treatment Facility in accordance with state and county regulations.

Ancillary Facilities:

a.

Garbage Containers and Portable Toilets are the only ancillary facilities proposed in this
application.

Well Site Layout: (See Exhibit B)

a.

The well will be properly identified in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6.

b. Access to the well pad will be from the northwest.




m.

The pad and road designs are consistent with BLM specification

A pre-construction meeting with responsible company representative, contractors, and the BLM
will be conducted at the project site prior to commencement of surface-disturbing activities. The
pad and road will be construction-staked prior to this meeting.

The pad has been staked at its maximum size of 355° X 200’; however it will be constructed
smaller if possible, depending upon rig availability. Should the layout change, this application
will be amended and approved utilizing a sundry notice.

All surface disturbing activities, will be supervised by a- qualified, responsible company
representative who is aware of the terms and conditions of the APD and specifications in the
approved plans.

All cut and fill slopes will be such that stability can be maintained for the life of the activity.

Diversion ditches will be constructed as shown around the well site to prevent surface waters form
entering the well site area.

The site surface will be graded to drain away from the pit to avoid pit spillage during large storm
events,

The stockpiled topsoil (first 6 inches or maximum available) will be stored in a windrow on the
uphill side of the location to prevent any possible contamination. All topsoil will be stockpiled
for reclamation in such a way as to prevent soil loss and contamination.

Pits will remain fenced until site cleanup.

The blooie line will be located at least 100 feet from the well head.

Water injection may be implemented if necessary to minimize the amount of fugitive dust.

Plans for Restoration of the Surface:

Site reclamation for a producing well will be accomplished for portions of the site not required for
the continued operation of the well.

The Operator will control noxious weeds along access road use authorizations, pipeline route
authorizations, well sites, or other applicable facilities by spraying or mechanical removal. A list
of noxious weeds may be obtained from the BLM or the appropriate County Extension Office.
On and BLM administered land, it is required that a Pesticide Use Proposal be submitted and
approved prior to the application of herbicides, pesticides or possibly hazardous chemicals.

Upon well completion, any hydrocarbons in the pit shall be removed in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.7-1.0nce the reserve pit is dry, the plastic nylon reinforced liner shall be torn and perforated
before backfilling of the reserve pit. The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed
for production facilities/operations will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours,

The cut and fill slopes and all other disturbed areas not needed for the production operation will
be top soiled and re-vegetated. The stockpiled topsoil will be evenly distributed over the
disturbed area.

Prior to reseeding the site, all disturbed areas, including the access road, will be scarified and left
with a rough surface. The site will then be seeded and/or planted as prescribed by the BLM. The
BLM recommended seed mix will be detailed within their approval documents.




il. Surface and Mineral Qwnership:

a. Surface Ownership -~ Federal under the management of the Bureau of Land Management - Vernal
Field Office, 170 South 500 East, Vernal, Utah 84078; 435-781-4400.

b. Mineral Ownership — Federal under the management of the Bureau of Land Management - Vernal
Field Office, 170 South 500 East, Vernal, Utah 84078; 435-781-4400.
12. Other Information:

a. AlA Archaeological has conducted a Class 11 archeological survey. A copy of the report has
been submitted under separate cover to the appropriate agencies by AIA Archaeological.

b. Alden Hamblin will conduct a paleontological survey. A copy of the report will be submitted
under separate cover to the appropriate agencies by Alden Hamblin.

¢.  Our understanding of the results of the onsite inspection are:

a. No Threatened and Endangered flora and fauna species were found during the onsite
inspection.

b. The well makes use of the Hill Creek Crossing and tribal access road previously applied
for within the LCU 15-9H documents.

¢. No endangered plants were found during the onsite inspection and the pad and access
road avoids potential habitat for known endangered plants.

d. The wellsite has been relocated 109’ to accommodate a drainage deemed avoidable at
the onsite inspection.




13. Operator’s Representative and Certification
Title Name Office Phone
Company Representative (Roosevelt)  Ken Secrest 1-435-722-4521
Company Representative (Oklahoma)  Carla Christian 1-405-749-5263
Agent for Dominion Don Hamilton 1-435-637-4075
Certification:

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed
drill site and access route; that [ am familiar with the conditions which currently exists; that
the statements made in this APD package are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct;
and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by
Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc, and its contractors and subcontractors in
conformity with this APD package and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. 1
also certify responsibility for the operations conducted on that portion of the leased lands
associated with this application, with bond coverage being provided under Dominion’s BLM
bond. This statement is subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false
statement,

Signature: Date:




13. Operator’s Representative and Certification
Title Name Office Phone
Company Representative (Roosevelt)  Ken Secrest 1-435-722-4521
Company Representative (Oklahoma) Carla Christian 1-405-749-5263
Agent for Dominion Don Hamilton 1-435-637-4075

Certification:

T hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed
drill site and access route; that T am familiar with the conditions which currently exists; that
the statements made in this APD package are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct;
and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by
Dominjon Exploration & Production, Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors in
conformity with this APD package and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. I
also certify responsibility for the operations conducted on that portion of the leased lands
associated with this application, with bond coverage being provided under Dominion’s BLM
bond. This statement is subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false
statement.

Signature: —Dm\ Ha/nu/,én Date: 7‘ &- 08




DOMINION EXPLR. & PROD., INC.,

LCU #11-9H
SECTION 9, T11S, R20E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL, UTAH ALONG U.S.
HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 14.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATE
HIGHWAY 88; EXIT LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 17.0 MILES TO OURAY, UTAH; PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 9.1
MILES ON THE SEEP RIDGE ROAD TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 2.8 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF
THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE WEST; TURN RIGHT AND
PROCEED IN A WESTERLY, THEN SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 6.6 MILES TO THE BEGINNING OF THE PROPOSED ACCESS
FOR THE #159H TO THE SOUTHEAST; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN A
SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.9 MILES TO THE BEGINNING OF THE PROPOSED ACCESS
TO THE EAST; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.1 MILES TO THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 50.5 MILES.
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UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 7891017




PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS

- Since 1964 -

DOMINION EXPLR. & PROD., INC.
LCU #11-9H

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 9, T11S, R20E, S.L.B.&M.
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Q WORKSHEET ,
PLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRIL

APD RECEIVED: 07/13/2005 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-36896
WELL NAME: LCU 11-9H

OPERATOR: DOMINION EXPL & PROD ( N1095 )

CONTACT: DON HAMILTON PHONE NUMBER: 435-650-1886

PROPOSED LOCATION:

NESW 09 1108 200E INSPECT LOCATN BY: /
SURFACE: 2229 FSL 1989 FWL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 2229 FSL 1989 FWL
UINTAH Engineering
UNDESIGNATED 2 ) Geology
LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface
LEASE NUMBER: UTU-76265
SURFACE OWNER: 1l - Federal
LATITUDE: 39.87380
PROPOSED FORMATION: MVRD
COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.6855
RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:
v Plat R649-2-3.
v" Bond: Fed(l] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] Unit LITTLE CANYON
(No. 765630500330 )
L! Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General
h[ 0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
Y. Water Permit _Mﬁi R649-3-3. Exception
(No. 43-10447 )
N - Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N)
(Date: ) Board Cause No:
Eff Date:
MB  Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:
__ R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS :

STIPULATIONS:

,"k£2otbﬁalﬁ)l1¥apruvuff\
21 pacing \Srp
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United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office
P.0O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3160
(UT-922)
July 14, 2005
Memorandum
To: Aggistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District
From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2005 Plan of Development Little Canyon Unit
Uintah County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of 0il, Gas and
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management, the following wells are planned for calendar year
2005 within the Little Canyon Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

APl # WELL NAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ MesaVerde)

43-047-36891 LCU 9-3H Sec 3 T11S R20E 2173 FSL 0739 FEL
43-047-36892 LCU ©5-9H Sec 9 T11S R20E 1943 FNL 0433 FWL
43-047-36896 LCU 11-9H Sec 9 T11S R20E 2229 FSL 1989 FWL
43-047-36893 LCU 5-17H Sec 17 T11S R20E 2013 FNL 0730 FWL

This office has no objections to permitting the wells at this
time.

/s8/ Michael L. Coulthard

bece: File - Little Canyon Unit
Divigion of 0il Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron

MCoulthard:mc:7-14-05



JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R, HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah July 18, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER

Executive Director Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc.
. 14000 Quail Springs Parkway, Suite 600
Division of Oklahoma City, OK 73134
Oil, Gas & Mining
JOHN R, BAZA
Division Director Re:  Little Canyon Unit 11-9H Well, 2229' FSL, 1989' FWL. NE SW.,
Sec. 9, T. 11 South, R. 20 East, Uintah County, Utah
Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative
approval of the requested exception location is hereby granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36896.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt

Acting Associate Director
pab
Enclosures

cc:  Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 « facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov




Operator: Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc.

Well Name & Number Little Canyon Unit 11-9H

API Number: 43-047-36896

Lease: UTU-76265

Location: _NE SW Sec. 9 T. _11 South R. 20 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Qil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well,
. Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
. Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.



‘.
Form 3160-5

UNITEDSTATES

FORM APPROVED
Budget Burean No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT HE INTERIOR .
(e 1959 BUREAU OF LAS AGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
. 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-76265
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to decpen or reentry to a different reservoir. - -
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 6. If Im!ll\’m;nA Allottee or Tribe Name
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE 7. T Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
Little Canyon Unit
1. Type of Well
i 8. Well Name and No.
> e L] LCU 11-9H
2. Name of Operator -
Dominion Exploration & Production, Inc. 9. API Well No.
43-047-36896
3. Address and Telephone No.
14000 Quail Springs Parkway, Suite 600, Oklahoma City, OK 73134, 405-749-6690 |10. Field ;Ind Pool, g Et’tfpbmfy Area
atural Buttes
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec.,T., Rz, M., or Survey Description) '
2,229’ FSL, 1,989’ FWL, NE/4 SW/4, Section 9, T118, R20E, SLB&M 11. Com?J?ft‘;;lﬂﬂ&;?:ﬂ
ntan,

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
|| Notice of intent
[X] subscquent Report D Change of Name (O Change of Plans
Recompletion New Construction

[J Final Abandonment Notice O Ploing Back O New Construct
(O Pluegmg Bac {7} Non-Routine Fracturing
(J Casing Repair (O water Shut-Off
(O Altering Casing O cConversion to Injection
[3 Road relocation D Dispose Water

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations ( Clearly state afl pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. H well is
directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

The proposed road for the LCU 11-9H has been relocated slightly on federal lands following the federal
onsite and APD submission but prior to BLM approval to avoid known populations of endangered plant
species

PECTIVED
ST 21 408

Attached please find an updated Topo A and Topo B for the LCU 11-9H

I I L B IR A N LR
S OF O, GAD & i

FILE COPY

N OMY
14. 1hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Signed . n Hamilton Title Agent for Dominion Date QOctober 11, 2005
(This space for Federal or State office use)
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent
statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
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Form 3140.5

(b 4 UNITE@RTATES . FORM APPROVED
: DEPARTMENT 3 THE INTERIOR N OMB No. 1004-0135
i BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Expires; November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.

UTU - 76265

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals te drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well

i ey ; Little Canyon Unit
D)il Well E Gas Well D)ther . R U O :2’ 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator — LCU 11-9H
9. API Well No.
DOMINION EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC.
3a. Address Suite 600 3b, Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36896

14000 QUAIL SPGS PKWY, OKLA CITY, OK 73134 405-749-1300

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Scc., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

Natural Buttes

11. County or Parish, State
2229'FSL & 1989' FWL, (NE SW) Sec. 9-118-20E

Uintah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
m Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Star/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
D Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon APD Extension
D Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Piug Back Water Disposal

Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, inchiding estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof,
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA.  Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days

following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion In a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. i

Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

The state APD for this well expires July 18, 2006. Dominion is hereby requesting a one year extension.

2N

Approverd bv the
e S
Oil, Gus

COPY SENT TOOPEpaT

L —_
i %pf@"

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name  (Printed/lyped)

Carla Christian

Title Sr. Regulatory Specialist
Signature C ™! 6/19/2006

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease|  Office

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.5.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.5.C. Section 1212, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any depart

United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. ﬁg&%
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Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension
Validation

(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-36896
Well Name: LCU11-9H
Location: Section 9-115-20K, 2229' FSL & 1989' FWL

Company Permit Issued to: Dominion Exploration & Production, Tnc.
Date Original Permit Issued: 7/18/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes[INo[]

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? Yes[ONo]

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? Yesd Nok]

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? Yes[ No i

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? YesCONok/

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which will require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? Yes[C1Nol¥]

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Yes ZINoO

(\Q A \}VQ CW 6/20/2006

Signature Date

Title:  sr. Regulatory Specialist

Representing:  pominion Exploration & Production, Inc.

RECEIVED
JUN LT 25

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1.DJJ
2. CDW
X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/6/2006
FROM: (O1d Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2115-Westport Oil & Gas Co., LP N2995-Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP
1368 South 1200 East 1368 South 1200 East
Vernal, UT 84078 Vemnal, UT 84078
Phone: 1-(435) 781-7024 Phone: 1-(435) 781-7024
CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG|API NO ENTITY [LEASE |WELL |WELL
NO TYPE TYPE | STATUS

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 5/10/2006

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 5/10/2006

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 3/7/2006
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 1355743-0181

4b. IfNO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

Sa. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a

Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 3/27/2006 BIA not vet
7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 3/27/2006
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 5/15/2006
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 5/15/2006
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 5/15/2006
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 5/16/2006
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on:
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a  Name Change Only
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: C01203
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLB0005239
3. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number RIL.B0005236
a. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a __ rider added KMG

The Division sent response by letter on:

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

4. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 5/16/2006

COMMENTS:

KMG (Westport) FORM A.xls 9/18/2006



* Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

OMB No. 1004-0135
NREIZse) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Bxpies Inavember 30, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS MULTIPLE LEASES
Do not use this form for proposals to drlll or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side

1. Type of Well
D Oil Well m Gas Well D Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator MUTIPLE WELLS
KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 9. API Well No.
3a.  Address 3b.  Phone No. (include area code)
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4.  Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)

11. County or Parish, State

SEE ATTACHED UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent [ Acidize [ Decpen [ Production (Star/Resume) D Water Shut-Off
D Alter Casing D Fracture Treat D Reclamation D Well Integrity
Subsequent Report [ casing Repair [ New Construction [} Recomplete Other CHANGE OF
[ change Plans ) Plug and Abandon [ Temporarily Abandon OPERATOR
D Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection D Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof. -
I the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones,
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a2 multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site isready for final inspection

PLEASE BE ADVISED THAT KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP, IS CONSIDERED TO BE THE RECEIVED
OPERATOR OF THE ATTACHED WELL LOCATIONS. EFFECTIVE JANUARY 6, 2006.

KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP, IS RESPONSIBLE UNDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS MAY 1 0 2006
OF THE LEASE(S) FOR THE OPERATIONS CONDUCTED UPON LEASE LANDS. BOND COVERAGE
IS PROVIDED BY STATE OF UTAH NATIONWIDE BOND NO. RLB0005237. g)lv, OF OIL, GAS & MININC
BoND = £ APPROVED _g//6 /0
BLm = C0/403

B/p BONL = LB o0 E5R39 Conds

' N £

14. 1 hereby certify thal the foregoing is true and correct S IBARSTRAT ’

Nargeq Printed/Typed) - Earlene Russell, Engineering Technlclan
\NDY BAYNE DRILLING MANAGER
ighrature Date
[ May 9, 2006
[ THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or | QOffice

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease

which would entitle the applicant to conduet eperations thereon,

“Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the Uniled States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as (o any matier within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse)



Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) OMB No. 10040135
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires Jnovember 30, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS MULTIPLE LEASES
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No,
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side

1. Type of Well
ot wen  [X) Gaswett [ Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator MUTIPLE WELLS
WESTPORT OIL & GAS COMPANY L.P. 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b.  Phone No. (include area code)
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 10. Field and Poo!, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)

11. County or Parish, State

SEE ATTACHED UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent O Acidize [ Deepen D Production (Start/Resume) D Water Shut-Off
D Alter Casing D Fracture Treat D Reclamation D Well Integrity
Subsequent Report [ casing Repair [J New Construction (O Recomplete Other CHANGE OF
) (O Change Plans (] Plug and Abandon [] Temporarily Abandon OPERATOR
D Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection  [_] Plug Back [ water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No, on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed.  Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

EFFECTIVE JANUARY 6, 2006, WESTPORT OIL & GAS COMPANY L.P., HAS RELINQUISHED
THE OPERATORSHIP OF THE ATTACHED WELL LOCATIONS TO KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS

ONSHORE LP,
APPROVED 5 //6 06 RECEIVED

Division of Oil, Ges nd Mining MAY 1.0 2006
Earlene Russell, Englneering Technlclan T

14, T hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed/Typed) Title
BRAD LANEY ENGINEERING SPECIALIST
Signature Date

May 9, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Appreyved by “Title Date
&Mﬁ INOANAN 5-2-00
Conditions of appro®ed; if any, are al Approval of this notice does not warrant or | Office

certify that the applicant holds legalef equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would enttle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

“Title 18 US.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any

false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse)



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Colorado State Office
2850 Youngfisid Street
Lakewood, Colorado 80215-7076

IN REPLY REFER TO:

C0922 (MM)
3106
COCO017387 et. al.
March 23, 2006
NOTICE
Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore L.P.

1999 Broadway, Suite 3700 Oil & Gas
Denver, CO 80202 :

Merger/Name Change - Recognized

On February 28, 2006 this office received acceptable evidence of the following mergers and name
conversion:

Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore L.P., a Delaware Limited Partnership, and Ker-McGee
Qil & Gas Onshore LLC, a Delaware Limited Partnership merger with and into Westport
Oil and Gas Company L.P., a Delaware Limited Partnership, and subsequent Westport
Oil & Gas Company L.P. name conversion to Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore L.P.

For our purposes the merger and name conversion was effective January 4, 20086, the date the
Secretary of State of Delaware authenticated the mergers and name conversion.

Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore L.P. provided a list of oil and gas leases held by the merging
parties with the request that the Bureau of Land Management change all their lease records from
the named entities to the new entity, Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore L.P. In response to this
request each state is asked to retrieve their own list of leases in the names of these entities from
the Bureau of Land Management's (BLM) automated LR2000 data base.

The oil and gas lease files identified on the list provided by Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore L.P.
have been updated as to the merger and name conversion. We have not abstracted the lease files
to determine if the entities affected by the acceptance of these documents holds an interest in the
lease, nor have we attempt to identify leases where the entity is the operator on the ground that
maintains vested record title or operating rights interests. If additional documentation, for change
of operator, is required you will be contacted directly by the appropriate Field Office. The Mineral
Management Services (MMS) and other applicable BLM offices were notified of the merger with a
copy of this notice

Please contact this office if you identify additional leases where the merging party maintains an
interest, under our jurisdiction, and we will document the case files with a copy of this notice. If the
leases are under the jurisdiction of another State Office that information will be forwarded to them
for their action.



Three riders accompanied the merger/name conversion documents which will add Kerr-McGee Oil
and Gas Onshore LLC as a principal to the 3 Kerr-McGee bonds maintained by the Wyoming State
Office. These riders will be forward to them for their acceptance.

The Nationwide Oil & Gas Continental Casualty Company Bond #158626364 (BLM Bond
#C01203), maintained by the Colorado State Office, will remain in full force and effect until an
assumption rider is accepted by the Wyoming State Office that conditions their Nationwide Safeco
bond to accept all outstanding liability on the oil and gas leases attached to the Colorado bond.

If you have questions about this action you may call me at 303.239.3768.

Is/Martha L. Maxwell
Martha L. Maxwell

Land Law Examiner

Fluid Minerals Adjudication

Attachment:
List of OG Leases to each of the following offices:
MMS MRM, MS 357B-1
WY, UT, NM/OK/TX, MT/ND, WY State Offices
CO Field Offices
Wyoming State Office
Rider #1 to Bond WY2357
Rider #2 to Bond WY 1865
Rider #3 to Bond WY 1127



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

http://www.blm.gov

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3106

(UT-922)

March 27, 2006

Memorandum

To: Vernal Field Office
From: Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Subject: Merger Approval

Attached is an approved copy of the merger recognized by the Bureau of Land Management,
Colorado State Office. We have updated our records to reflect the merger from Westport Oil and
Gas Company L.P. into Kerr-McGee Onshore Oil and Gas Company. The merger was approved

effective January 4, 2006.
¢

Chief, Branch of
Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
Approval letter from BLM COSO (2 pp)

cc: MMS, Reference Data Branch, James Sykes, PO Box 25165, Denver CO 80225
State of Utah, DOGM, Attn: Earlene Russell, PO Box 145801, SLC UT 84114
Teresa Thompson
Joe Incardine
Connie Seare
Dave Mascarenas
Susan Bauman

Y
H
&

P

MAR 2 8 2006



JUL 28 2905 FORM APPROVED

Form 3100-3
OMB No. 1004-01306

(August 19499

UNITED STATES : : Expires November 30, 2000
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-80940

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

6. 1f indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER

7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

la. Type of Work: [X] DRILL ] REENTER
8. Lease Name and Well No.

. Type of Well: D Oil well Gas Well E] Other D Single Zone @ Multiple Zone HATCH 923-24M
2. Name of Operator 9. APl Well Ng.

KERR MCGEE OIL AND GAS ONSHORE LP 45 d};’) ) (ﬂg Zﬂﬁ
3JA. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST, VERNAL, UTAH 84078 (435) 781-7003
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any Stale requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R, M, or Bik, and Survey or Area

At surfuce SWSW 508 FSL 823' FWL
SEC 24-T9S-R23E

At proposed prod. Zone
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State
28.1 MILES SOUTHEAST OF OURAY, UTAH Ulintah UT
T3, Distance from proposed® 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
locanon 1o neurest .
properly or lease line, fl. 508
{Also 10 nearest drig. unit line, if any) 1280 40
TS, Dhstance Trom proposed location® : 2 M/ d N 3
st well drll)l(ling, completed. REFER TO 19. Proposed .Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
apphied for. on this lease. fi TOPO C 8500 CO-1203
1. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start*® 23. Estimated duration
5200.4' GL UPON APPROVAL TO BE DETERMINED

24, Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore 0il and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan. ftem 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.
SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized office.
25 Aogphture i Name (Printed/Typed) s Date
9?4’4/”0 24 %]ﬂw . RAMEY HOOPES | 41312006
et / v !
REGULATORY CLERK
+ Name (Printed/Typed) + Date

Approved by (Signajure)
2 L | Treey Mveesa | fse-2cey

Assistant Field Manager iOfﬁce VERNAL EIEL D AFEICE

Mineral Resources

roval does not warrant er certify that the applicant holds tegal or equitable title to those rights in the subj

Title

Application app ect lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct

operations thereon.

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

ITIUNS OF AFPROV. .i,
AU"t:hePs?d_ by the Mﬂm
Oil, Gas %ﬁ'mﬁg JAN 30 7307

FOR RECORD ONLY DIV. OF O, GAS & MINING

agency ot the United

*(Instructions on reverse)

L
AL




UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
VERNAL FIELD OFFICE

170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078  (435) 781-4400

..
Yancn 3 B

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

L m A A R A L

Company: Westport Oil & Gas Company, L.P. Location: SWSW, Sec. 24, T9S, R23E

Well No: Hatch 923-24M Lease No: UTU-80940

API No: 43-047-36869 Agreement: N/A
Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker Office: 435-781-4490 Cell: 435-828-4470
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee Office: 435-781-4432 Cell: 435-828-7875
Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger Office: 435-781-4502 Cell: 435-828-3913
Environmental Scientist: Paul Buhler Office: 435-781-4475 Cell: 435-828-4029
Environmental Scientist: Karl Wright Office: 435-781-4484

Chris Carusona Office: 435-781-4441
Natural Resource Specialist: Holly Villa Office: 435-781-4404
Natural Resource Specialist: Melissa Hawk Office: 435-781-4476
Natural Resource Specialist: Nathaniel West Office: 435-781-4447
After hours contact number: (435) 781-4513 FAX: (435) 781-4410

Natural Resource Specialist:

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with the
applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Dritl including
Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible for the actions of
his subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD must be on location during construction, drilling, and
completion operations. This permit is approved for a one-year period. An additional year extension may
be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location
(Notify Holly Villa) and access roads.

Location Completion
(Notify Holly Villa)

Spud Notice
(Notify Petroleum Engineer)

.Casing String & Cementing
(Notify Jamie Sparger SPT)

BOP & Related Equipment Tests
(Notify Jamie Sparger SPT)

First Production Notice
(Notify Petroleum Engineer)

Prior to moving on the drilling rig.
Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and

cementing all casing strings.

Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure
tests.

Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
production resumes after well has been off production
for more than ninety (90) days.



Page 2 of 7
Hatch 923-24M
4/5/2006

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

If paleontologic materials are uncovered during construction, the operator shall
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials and contact the
Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will be made by the AO as to what mitigation
will be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material.

A Paleontologist acceptable to the BLM will monitor construction activity for surface
disturbing activities described in the APD. If paleontologic resources are uncovered
during construction activities, the operator shall immediately suspend all operations that
will further disturb such resources, and immediately notify the Authorized Officer (AO).
The AO will arrange for a determination of significance and, if necessary, recommend a
recovery or avoidance plan. Also all roads and location will be constructed as staked.

The lessee/operator is given notice that lands in the lease have been identified as
containing Golden Eagle habitat. ltis requested that the lessee/operator not initiate
surface disturbing activities or drilling from February 1% through July 15". A survey may
be conducted by a qualified biologist or a BLM representative during this timing period to
determine if Golden Eagles are nesting in the area.

The fo|.|owing interim seed mixture shall be used:

Type Ibs./acre
Needle and Thread grass _Stipa commata 6
Crested Wheat grass Agropyron cristatum 6

* Seed shall be drilled; but if broadcasted, double the pounds per
acre used and work the solids mechanically to cover the seed.

= All pounds are in pure live seed.

» Reseeding may be required if first seeding is not successful.

The topsoil from the reserve pit shall be stripped and piled separately near the reserve
pit. When the reserve pit is closed, it shall be recontoured and the topsoil respread, and
the area shall be seeded in the same manner as the location topsoil.

Following well plugging and abandonment, the location, access roads, pipelines, and
other facilities shall be reclaimed. All disturbed surfaces shall be reshaped to
approximate the original contour; the top soil respread over the surface; and, the surface
revegetated. The surface of approved staging areas where construction activities did not
occur may require disking or ripping and reseeding.

Within 90 calendar days of the approval date for this Application for Permit to Drill (APD),
the operator/lessee shall submit to the Authorized Officer (AO), on Sundry Notice Form
3160-5, an Interim Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on well pads,
access roads, and pipelines. Ata minimum, this will include the reshaping of the pad to
the original contour to the extent possible; the respreading of the top soil up to the rig
anchor points; and, the area reseeded using appropriate reclamation methods. The AO
will provide written approval or concurrence within 30 calendar days of receipt.
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o Approximately 1,300 feet of the pipeline runs off lease and requires a BLM right-of way.
Also approximately 2,000 feet of the pipeline requires a Right-of-Way from a private

surface owner.
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DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

All provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized: :

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

None

DRILLING/COMPLETION/PRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS

There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover
program as approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. All wells,
whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well. Any changes in
operation must have prior approval from the BLM, Vernal Field Office Petroleum
Engineers.

The spud date and time shall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding. ’

Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least

24 hours in advance of casing cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure

tests.

Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) will remain in use until the well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls must remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all
times. Choke manifolds must be located outside of the rig substructure.

All BOPE components will be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in
the daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by
Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE

" pressure tests must be performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and NOT by the

rig pumps. Test must be reported in the driller’s log.

BOP drills must be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out
from under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas
Order No. 2.

Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set
and cemented in place.

No aggressive/fresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

All shows of fresh water and minerals will be reported and protected. A sample will be
taken of any water flows and a water analysis furnished the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All
oil and gas shows will be adequately tested for commercial possibilities, reported, and
protected.

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or

- workover equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status

without prior approval of the BLM, Vernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended
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for more than 30 days, prior approval of the BLM, Vernal Field Office must be obtained
and notification given before resumption of operations.

Chronologic drilling progress reports must be filed directly with the BLM, Vernal Field
Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers
until the well is completed.

Any change in the program must be approved by the BLM, Vernal Field Office. "Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be filed for all changes of plans
and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Emergency approval may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the
written report requirement. Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of
facilities, including roads, gathering lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the
disturbance of new ground, will require the filing of a suitable plan pursuant to Onshore
Oil & Gas Order No. 1 of 43 CFR 3164.1 and prior approval by the BLM, Vernal Field
Office.

In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well must be reported on the "Monthly Report
of Operations" (Qil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in
which operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged
and abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals
Management Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 8021 7-0110, or call 1-800-
525-7922 (303) 231-3650 for reporting information.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30
days after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all
other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or
completion operations, will be filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well
completion report a geologic report including, at a minimum, formation tops, and a
summary and conclusions. Also include deviation Surveys, sample descriptions, strip
logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if performed.
Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) will be submitted only when requested by the BLM,
Vernal Field Office.

Please submit an electronic copy of all logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM. The cement bond log must be submitted in
raster format (TIF, PDF other).

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease will
have prior written approval from the BLM, Vernal Field Office.

All measurement points shall be identified as point of sales or allocation for royalty
determination prior to the installation of facilities.

Oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The Field Office
Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be
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submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the
API standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas
measurement.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Qil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production,
whichever occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas
Order No. 3 shall be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon
storage tanks will be effectively sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No.
3.

This APD is approved subject to the requirement that, shall the well be successfully
completed for production, the BLM, Vernal Field office must be notified when it is placed
in a producing status. Such notification will be by written communication and must be
received in this office by not later than the fifth business day following the date on which
the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a minimum, the
following informational items:

Operator name, address, and telephone number.

Well name and number.

Well location (Y%, Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for

which royalty will be paid).

The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing

head gas, or natural gas and entrained liquid hydrocarbons).

o The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is
located; otherwise the non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State
or private.

o Unit agreement and / or participating area name and number, if
applicable.

o Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

O O 0O

(e}

Any venting or flaring of gas will be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A
and needs prior approval from Field Office Petroleum Engineers.

Ali undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL
3A will be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events as defined in NTL3A,
will be reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days.
"Other than Major Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will
be reported on the Monthly Report of Operations and Production.

Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A
permanent disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the
end of this 90-day period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed
permanent disposal method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses,
as soon as possible, but no later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any
method of disposal which has not been approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-
day period will be considered as an Incident of Noncompliance and will be grounds for
issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for disposing of said water is provided
and approved by this office.
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Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field
Office Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging
of the well, in order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is
suspended or abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled.
The "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within
30 days after the actual plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of
cement in each, and amount of casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface
restoration.



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES ot

(Auguet 1999 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires oveesber 30, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-80940
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

7. IfUnit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side

1. Type of Well
[ oit went GasWell [_] Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator HATCH 923-24M
KERR MCGEE OIL AND GAS ONSHORE LP 9. API Well No.
3a.  Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304736869
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST, VERNAL, UTAH 84078|(435)781-7003 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R, M., or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED
508' FSL, 823' FWL 11. County or Parish, State
SWSW, SEC 24-T9S-R23E UINTAH, UTAH
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
X Notice of Intent [ Acidize [C] Despen [ Production (Start/Resume) [ Water Shut-Off
[ Atter Casing [0} Fracture Treat [0 Reclamation ] Welt Integrity
[ Subsequent Report [} Casing Repair [J New Construction [} Recomplete X] Other APD EXTENSIOM
[CJ Change Plans [ Plugand Abandon [} Temporarily Abandon DOGM
[ Final Abandonment Notice [[J Convertto Injection [} Plug Back [ Water Disposal

13. Desctibe Proposed or Completed Operations (cleady state all pertinent detsils, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directiomlly or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsoquent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved opemtions. If the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, induding reclamation, have been completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

THE OPERATOR REZUESTS AUTHORIZATION FOR A ONE YEAR EXTENSION FOR THE SUBJECT WELL
LOCATION SO THAT THE DRILLING OPERATIONS MAY BE COMPLETED. TNE&BW&H@ WAS APPROVEL
BY THE DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING ON JULY 26, 2005. Utah Division of

Qil, Gas and Mining

14, Thercby certify that the foregoing is truc and correct

Name (Printed/Typed) Title
~—, RAMEY HOORES REGULATORY CLERK
Signature Date
H@M“A May 22, 2007
71\ SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE
Approved by Title Dato

U R L L R T R P T T LR

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached. Approval of this notice docs not warant or | Office
certify that the applicant holds logal or equitable tifl to those 1igits in the subjoct lease
which would entid ¢ the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Tiic 15 US C Section 1001, make i & orume Iof any person knowingly and willfully to make to any Gepartment of SgeD o StthaUnted Stake

(Instructions on reverss)

DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING



Application for Permit to Drill

Request for Permit Extension
Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)
API: (4304736869 |
Well Name: HATCH 923-24M
Location: SWSW, SEC 24-T9S-R23E

Company Permit Issued to: KERR MCGEE OIL AND GAS ONSHORE LP
Date Original Permit Issued: 7/26/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes[CINo 7]

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? Yes[JNok/]

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesCINo i1

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? Yes[CINo i1

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? Yes[CONoi

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which will require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? Yes[CINokZl

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Yes ZINo[]

5/22/2007
Signa Date

Title: REGULATORY CLERK

Representing: Kerr McGee Oil and Gas Onshore LP




@ Form3160-5 UNT FORM APPROVED
) (AuBust 1999) - TED STATES ' OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires Jnovember 30, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT T
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU—80540 ’
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. IfIndl?lgAﬂotﬁ?,qr Tri.?e Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. OCJRR =1 PH [ 1

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side

L. Type of Well

L) on weil [XJ Gas wen [ Other : 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator . HATCH 923"24M
KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 9. APIWell No.
3a.  Address - 3b. . Phone No. (include area code) 4304736869
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL, UT 84078 |(435) 781-7024 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec.; T., R., M., or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED

11. County or Parish, State

SW/SW SEC. 24, T9S, R23E 508'FSL, 823'FWL UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION ‘ TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent 1 [ Acidize [ Deepen ] Production (Start/Resume) [_] Water Shut-Off
] Alter Casing [ Fracture Treat ] Reclamation ] Well Integrity
I:] Subsequent Report ] Casing Repair [CJ New Construction [_] Recomplete X} Other BLM APD
{ [ Change Plans [} Plugand Abandon [_] Temporarily Abandon EXTENSION
["] Final Abandonment Notice [ Convert to Injection [} Plug Back [[] Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated staiting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, incduding reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site isready for final inspection.

THE OPERATOR REQUESTS AUTHORIZATION FOR A ONE YEAR EXTENSION FOR THE SUBJECT WELL
LOCATION, SO THAT THE DRILLING OPERATIONS MAY BE COMPLETED. THE ORIGINAL APD WAS
APPROVED BY THE BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT ON JANUARY 16, 2007..

\ RECEIVED
L OUAN 18 2

14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title
SHEILA UPCHEGO SENIOR LAND ADMIN SPECIALIST

2 A Date
January 3, 2008

Date

Engineer JAN10 7008

Title

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 US.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any

(Instructions on reverse)

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL ATTACHED



CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

Kerr McGee Qil and Gas Onshore LP.

Notice of Intent SN

APD Extension
Lease: UTU-80940
Well: Hatch 923-24M
Location: SWSW Sec 24-T9S-R23E

An extension for the referenced APD is granted with the following conditions:

1. The extension and APD shall expire on 1/16/09.
2. No other extension shall be granted.

If you have any other questions concerning this métter, please contact Ryan Angus of this office
at (435) 781-4430



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-80940
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS TR ORTRBE A

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drilt horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

oLwetL [ 1 GASWELL OTHER Hatch 923-24M
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP 4304736869
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
PO Box 173779 iy Denver stare CO 2 80217-3779) (720) 929-6171 Natural Buttes Field
4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT surRFace: 508 FSL & 823 FWL county: Uintah
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWSW 24 9S 23E STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ acioize [] obeeren [T] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

Iz‘ NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [] ALteER CcAsiNG [] FracTure TREAT [[] SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casnaRrePAR 7] newconsTRucTION [[] TEMPORARILY ABANDON

[] cHaNGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [ OPERATOR GHANGE [7] Tvencrerar
[] cHance TusiNG [ ] PLUG AND ABANDON [] ventorFLARE

[1 suBSEQUENT REPORT [] cHanGE weLL NAME [] Puesack [] waTer pisPosAL

{Submit Original Form Oniy)
[] cHaNGE weLL STATUS [] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [[] WATER sHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

[[] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS ||  RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE otHer: APD Extension
[[] cONVERT WELL TYPE [[] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Kerr-McGee Oil and Gas Onshore, LP, respectfully requests a one year extension for Hatch 923-13M, in order to complete
drilling operations. The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining initially approved this APD on 07/26/2005.

Approved by the
Utah Division qf
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: (5 -2 2 ~4&XE_ COPY SENT TO OPERATOR
By: Date: S+ 28 2008
Initials: ____MAS

Victoria Marques Regulatory Intern

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) TITLE

SIGNATURE ‘MW DATE 5/15/2008

{This space for State use only) R EC E PJE a:} | R E C EIVE D

MAY 19 2008 MAY 23 2008
DiV. OF OiL, GAS & MiNiNg

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 4304736869
Well Name: Hatch 923-24M
Location: SWSW 508’ FSL & 823' FWL Sec. 24, T 9S R 23E

Company Permit Issued to: Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP
Date Original Permit Issued: 7/26/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes[ONo

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesCONo ]

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? Yes[ONo

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesONo &2

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? Yes[dJNok

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which will require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? Yes[INolZ

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? YesZINoJ

Zé@” % i 5/22/2008
Signature Date

Title: Regulatory Intern

Representing:  gerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP

RECEIVED
MAY 2°3 2008
DIV. OF Oi, GAS & MiNina



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION
Name of Company: KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.
Well Name: HATCH 923-24M
Api No: 43-047-36869 Lease Type:_ FEDERAL

Section_24  Township__09S Range 23E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor PETE MARTIN DRLG RIG#__BUCKET
SPUDDED:

Date 09/08/08

Time 8:00 AM

How DRY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by LEW WELDON

Telephone # (435) 828-7035

Date 09/08/08 Signed CHD




’ormS 160-5

UNITED STATES
(Aungust 1999)

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0135
Expires Jnovember 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-80940

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side

7. I Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

8. Well Name and No.

1. Type of Well
[(Joit wen [XIcaswen [ other
2. Name of Operator

KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP

HATCH 923-24M

9. API Well No.

3a.  Address
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL, UT 84078

3b.

Phone No. (include area code)

(435) 781-7024

4304736869

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4.  Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

SW/SW SEC. 24, TSS, R23E 508' FSL, 823'FWL

UNDESIGNATED

11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

[] Notice of Intent [] Acidize

D Alter Casing

D Casing Repair

L__] Change Plans

i_] Convert to Injection

Subsequent Report

D Final Abandonment Notice

D Deepen

D Fracture Treat
D New Construction
I:] Plug and Abandon D Temporarily Abandon

D Plug Back

[J Production (Start/Resume) [_] Water Shut-Off
[] Reclamation [J Well Integrity
] Recomplete [] other

] Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of ail pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

MIRU PETE MARTIN BUCKET RIG. DRILLED 20" CONDUCTOR HOLE TO 40'. RAN 14" 36.7#
SCHEDULE 10 PIPE. CMT W/28 SX READY MIX.
SPUD WELL LOCATION ON 09/08/2008 AT 08:00 HRS.
14. 1hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed/Typed) Title

SHEWAUPCHEGO REGULATORY ANALYST

Tgnatyre - ‘< Date
7 /7.27))  |september 8, 2008
) ’ (1S SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date
_C-o ;d-iti.o;ls—o-f ;p_p;o?/;I,-i %a-xl;,_a;e_a;ta; ;e-d._ ;;y;r;v_al_o_f ;h;s-n; ti_c; zlo- e; ;1 o-t ;va-n-’a:lt or| Office
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Tifle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse)



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESQURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: KERR McGEE OlL & GAS ONSHORE LP Operator Account Number: N 2985
Address: 1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST
city VERNAL
state UT zip 84078 Phone Number; (435) 781-7024
Well 1
API| Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
4304736869 HATCH 923-24M SWsSw| 24 98, 23E UINTAH
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
R Number Number ‘ Effective Date
P 99999 /7059 9/8/2008 7/22/0¢
/ /

Comments: 1) pETE MARTIN BUCKET RIG. WS 7M1/

SPUD WELL LOCATION ON 09/08/2008 AT 0800 HRS. ————
Well 2 )
APl Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
Action Cade ‘Current Entity New. Entity Spud Date Entity Assignhment
Number Number Effective Date
Comments:
Well 3
APl Number Well Name QQ Sec | Twp | Rng County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number .Effective Date
Comments:

ACTION CODES:
- Establish new entity for new well (single well only)

- Add new well to existing entity (group er unit well)

« Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
- Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity

- Other (Explain in ‘comments’ section)

moOuw>»

Title Date

RECFIVED
Ser o 6 2008
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(6/2000)



. Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999)

OMB Na. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires Jnovember 30, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-80940
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

7. I Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE — Other instructions on reverse side

1. Type of Well
[Join wen X3 Gaswell [ Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator HATCH 923-24M
KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 9. API'Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 4304736869
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL, UT 84078 |(435) 781-7024 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4,  Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED
11. County or Parish, State
SW/SW SEC. 24, T9S, R23E 508' FSL, 823'FWL
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[_] Notice of Intent [ Acidize ] Deepen [ Production (Start/Resume) [_] Water Shut-Off
] Atter Casing ] Fracture Treat [C] Reclamation [] well Integrity
Subsequent Report |:] Casing Repair D New Construction D Recomplete D Other
] Change Plans [_] Plug and Abandon [C] Temporarily Abandon
[C] Final Abandonment Notice - [ Convert to Injection [ Plug Back [ Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of al pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site isready for final inspection.

MIRU PROPETRO AIR RIG ON 09/19/2008. DRILED 12 1/4" SURFACE HOLE TO 2250". RAN 9 5/8" 36#
J-55 SURFACE CSG. CMT W/350 SX PREM CLASS G @15.8 PPG 1.15 YIELD. NO RETURNS TO PIT.
175 PSI LIFT. TOP OUT W/150 SX PREM CLASS G @15.8 PPG 1.15 YIELD. DOWN BACKSIDE. 2ND
TOP OUT W/125 SX PREM CLASS G @15.8 PPG 1.15 YIELD. DOWN BACKSIDE. 3RD TOP OUT W/75
SX PREM CLASS G @15.8 PPG 1.15 YIELD. DOWN BACKSIDE GOOD CMT TO SURFACE HOLE
STAYED FULL.

WORT.
14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title
SHEAAUPCHEGO _ REGULATORY ANALYST

P } -z )
’ igrfatury b < Date
M W/% September 25, 2008
4 T

C}Ié SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached Approval of this notice does not warrantor |  Office

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Tifle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, maKke it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within ifs jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse) *ﬁﬁL t, VIL_ i ;

UCrog 2008
DiVOFOIl GAG 2 Mmnrim



Forin 3160-5
(August 1999)

FORM APPROVED
OMB No, 1004-0135
Expires Jnovember 30,2000

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-80840

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

6. IfIndian, Allottee or Tribe Name

‘ 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE — Other instructions on reverse side

1.

Type of Well

CJoil wet X} Gaswell [_] Other 3. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator
KERR-McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP

HATCH 923-24M

3a. Address

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL, UT 84078

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
(435) 781-7024

9. API Weli No.
4304736869

4, Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)

508’ FSL, 823' FWL
SWSW, SEC.24, T9S-R23E

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

11. County or Parish, State
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

[ Notice of Intent 1 Acidize
[X} Subsequent Report

[} Final Abandonment Notice

[Z] Alter Casing

[} Casing Repair

{_] Change Plans

] Convert to Injection

D Deepen

D Fracture Treat
D New Construction
[_] Plug and Abandon

D Plug Back

] Production (Start/Resume)
] Reclamation

] Recomplete

[C]) Temporarily Abandon
[T] water Disposal

[ Water Shut-Off

[ Well Integrity
X} other FINAL DRILLING

OPERATIONS

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or récompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site isready for final inspection.

- FINISHED DRILLING FROM 2250' TO 8290' ON 11/2/2008. RAN 4 1/2" 11.6# 1-80 PRODUCTION CSG.
LEAD CMT W/350 SX PREM LITE Il @11.3 PPG 3.02 YIELD. TAILED CMT W/1150 SX 50/50 POZ @
14.3 PPG 1.31 YIELD. BUMP PLUG 2640 PS| OVER FLOATS HELD. 12 BBLS BACK TO PIT. LAND CSG
TEST NIPPLE DOWN BOPE CLEAN TANKS. '

RELEASED PIONEER RIG 68 ON 11/2/2008 AT 0930 HRS

T4. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Nagae (Printed/Typed) Title N
SHEILA UPCHEGO REGULATORY ANALYST
Signalare -~ Date
was s e November 3, 2008
~ THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE
Approved by ’ Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Office

%
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and wilifully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
false, fictitious or frandulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse)

RECEIVED
© NV 0 4 2008
Div. OF OiL, GAS & MINING



‘ ‘

Form 3160-5 FORM APPROVED
- (AUUUSI 2007) UNITED STATES OMB No. 1004-0137
= DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: July 31, 2010
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-80940
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE — Other instructions on page 2. 7-1f Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well
Coiwell  [7] Gas well ] Other 8, Ayell Name and No-
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.
KERR McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736868
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL, UTAH 84078 435.781.7024 UNDESIGNATED
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M., or Survey Description) 11. Country or Parish, State
SWISW SEC. 24, T9S, R23E 508'FSL, 823 FWL UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent D Acidize I:I Deepen D Production (Start/Resume) D Water Shut-Off
I:] Alter Casing D Fracture Treat I:] Reclamation D Well Integrity
Subsequent Report I:] Casing Repair D New Construction D Recomplete IZI Other PRODUCTION
D Change Plans I:I Plug and Abandon I:] Temporarily Abandon START-UP
I:I Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection [_—_] Plug Back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof. If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

THE SUBJECT WELL LOCATION WAS PLACED ON PRODUCTION ON 11/27/2008 AT 11:30 AM.

PLEASE REFER TO THE ATTACHED CHRONOLOGICAL WELL HISTORY.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/Typed)
SHEILA UPCHEGO Title REGULATORY ANALYST

SignaturM Wﬁ Date 12/02/2008
;/ '_'I v VA4

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

~

Approved by

(Title : Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would  |Office

entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. R FCF I\IFn
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false,
fictitious or fraudulent statements O representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. NEFC R 2.nne

WESN VO LWL

(Instructions on page 2)

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Wins No.: 95084

HATCH 9_23-24M

Well Operations Summary Long

Operator FIELD NAME SPUD DATE GL KB ROUTE
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP NATURAL BUTTES 09/19/2008 5,200 5218 V14
APl STATE COUNTY DIVISION
4804736869 UTAH UINTAH ROCKIES
Long/lat: 40.01561/-109.28112 Q-Q/SectiTown/Range: ~ SWSW/24/98 1 23E Footages:  508.00' FSL 823.00' FWL
Wellbore: HATCH 923-24M
MTD VD PBMD PBTVD
8,290 8,285
EVENT INFORMATION: EVENT ACTIVITY: DRILLING START DATE: 9/19/2008 AFENO.: 2013828
OBJECTIVE: DEVELOPMENT END DATE: 11/2/2008
OBJECTIVE 2; VERTICAL WELL DATE WELL STARTED PROD.:
REASON: Event End Status: COMPLETE
RIG OPERATIONS: Begin Mobilization ~ Rig On Location  Rjg Charges  Rig Operation Start Finish Drilling Rig Release  Rig Off Location
09/19/2008 09/19/2008 09/19/2008 08/19/2008 09/23/2008 09/23/2008 09/23/2008
Date Time Duration | Phase | Code |Subco| PiU ' Operation
) Start-End (hr) de ]
8/19/2008 SUPERVISOR: LEW WELDON MD: 1,008
8:00 - 12:00 6.00 DRLSUR 02 P MOVE IN AND RIG UP AIR RIG SPUD WELL @ 0800 HR 9/15/08
DA AT REPORT TIME 360'
1200 - 0:00 12.00 DRLSUR 02 P RIG DRILLING AHEAD NO WATER 990°
9/20/2008 SUPERVISOR: LEW WELDON MD: 1,518
0:00 - 12:00 12,00 DRLSUR 02 P RIG DRILLING AHEAD HIT TRONA WATER @ 1120' DA AT
REPORT TIME 1250'
12:00 - 0:00 12.00 DRLSUR 02 P RIG DRILLING AHEAD CIRCULATING WITH SKID PUMP 1500'
9/21/2008 SUPERVISOR: LEW WELDON MD: 2,028
0:00 - 12:00 12.00 DRLSUR 02 P RIG DRILLING AHEAD CIRCULATING WITH SKiD PUMP 1850
12:00 - 0:00 12.00 DRLSUR 02 P RIG DRILLING AHEAD CIRCULATING WITH SKID PUMP 2010'
8/22/2008 SUPERVISOR: LEW WELDON MD:; 2,268
0:00 - 12:00 12.00 DRLSUR a2 P RIG DRILLING AHEAD CIRCULATING WITH SKID PUMP 2180’
12:00 - 0:00 12.00 DRLSUR 02 P RIG T/D @ 2250' CONDITION HOLE 2 HR
9/23/2008 SUPERVISOR: LEW WELDON MD: 2,268
0:00 - 4:00 4.00 DRLSUR 05 P TRIP DP OUT OF HOLE
4:00 - 8:00 4,00 DRLSUR 11 P RUN 2202' OF 9 5/8 CSG AND RIG DOWN AIR RIG
8:00 - 9:00 1.00 DRLSUR 15 P CEMENT 1ST STAGE WITH 350 SKS TAIL @ 15.8%# 1.15 5.0
GAL/SK NO RETURNS TO PIT 175 PSI LIFT
9:00 - 9:30 0.50 DRLSUR 15 P 1ST TOP JOB 150 SKS DOWN BS WOC
8:30 - 12:00 2.50 DRLSUR 15 P 2ND TOP JOB 125 SKS DOWN BS WOC
12:00 - 14:00 2.00 DRLSUR 15 P 3RD TOP JOB 75 SKS DOWN BS GOOD CMT TO SURFACE AND
STAYED AT SURFACE
14:00 - 14:00 0.00 DRLSUR NO VISIBLE LEAKS PIT WAS 1/4 FULL WORT
11/26/2008 8:21:47AM




Wins No.: 95084 'HATCH 923-24M o APINo.. 4904736869 |
14:00 - 14:00 0.00 DRLSUR NO VISIBLE LEAKS PIT WAS 1/4 FULL WORT
10/21/2008 SUPERVISOR: LEW WELDON MD: 2,268
20:30 - 0:00 3.50 DRLPRO 01 RIG DOWN TO MOVE TO HATCH 823-24M
10/22/2008 SUPERVISOR; | TiM OXNER MD: 2,268
0:00 - 9:00 9.00 DRLPRO 01 RDRT
9:00 - 14:30 5.50 DRLPRO 01 RDRT W/ J & C ENTERPRISE CRANE ASSISTANCE. WAITING ON
L& S TRUCKS. MAN CAMPS 100% MOVED & RIGGED UP.
RELEASE MOUNTAIN WEST @ 16:00
14:30 - 18:00 3.50 DRLPRO 01 L & S ON LOCATION @ 14:30. START MOVING RIG TO HATCH
923-24M
18:00 - 0:00 6.00 DRLPRO 01 DEMOBILIZATION.WAIT ON DAYLIGJHTS
10/23/2008 SUPERVISOR: TIM OXNER MD: 2,268
0:00 - 7:00 7.00 DRLPRO 01 DEMOBILIZATION
7:00 - 15:00 8.00 DRLPRO 01 MOVE RIG TO HATCH 923-24M. L&S TRUCKING 8 HAUL-4 BED-2
FORKLIFTS-4 SWAMPERS-1 PUSHER. L & S RELEASED @ 1500
J & C CRANE 1 OPERATOR - 2 SWAMPERS RELEASED @ 16:00
15:00 - 0:00 9.00 DRLPRO 01 RAISE DERRICK,SCOPE SUB & DERRICK. RURT
10/24/2008 SUPERVISOR: TIM OXNER MD: 2,268
0:00 - 6:30 6.50 DRLPRO 13 NIPPLE UP BOP & CHOKE,ETC.
8:30 - 7:00 0.50 DRLPRO 06 (PRE TOUR SAFETY MEETING) RIG SERVICE
7.00 - 11:00 4.00 DRLPRO 13 ( HELD SAFETY MEETING) RIG UP B & C QUICKTEST & TEST
KELLY & ALL FLOOR RELATED VALVES 250 TO 5000
PSIATTEMPT TO TEST BOP. PIPE RAMS LOCKING SHAFT
LEAKING.
11:00 - 15:30 450 DRLPRO 13 WAIT ON WEATHERFORD F/ PARTS.REPLACE PIPE RAM
LOCKING SHAFT,ETC. REPAIR BOP.
15:30 - 18:00 3.50 DRLPRO 13 TEST PIPE RAMS,BLIND RAMS & ALL CHOKE RELATED VALVES
F/ 250 PSI TO 5000 PSI.TEST HYDRILL F/ 250 PS] TO 2500 PSI.
TEST CSG TO1500 PSI & HOLD 30 MIN. INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
)
18:00 - 23:00 400 DRLPRO 05 ( HELD SAFETY MEETING ) RIG UP WEATHERFORD TRS. PICK
UP BHA @ 42 JT DP & TIH TO 2009’ RiG DOWN WEATHERFORD
23:00 - 0:00 1.00 DRLPRO 06 SLIP & CUT DRLG LINE
10/25/2008 SUPERVISOR: TIM OXNER MD: 3,894
0:00 - 1:00 1.00 DRLPRO 086 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE
1.00 - 2:00 1.00 DRLPRO 06 PRESPUD RIG INSPECTION & SERVICE
200 - 500 3.00 DRLPRO 02 DRILL FE & 54' PREDRILLED HOLE TO 2268' CMT TOP 2145'
FLOAT TOP 2172' SHOE TOP 2214' ROTARY SPUD @ 05:00
10/25/2008
500 - &:00 1.00 DRLPRO 02 DRILL F/ 2268' - 2336' 68 TOTAL @ 68' HR
6:00 - 6:30 0.50 DRLPRO 09 SURVEY @ 2260' 2.0 DEG
11/26/2008 8:21:47AM 2



Wins No.: 95084 HATCH 923-24M . APl No.: 4904736869
8:30 - 13:00 8.50 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 2336'- 3001" 685 TOTAL @ 102.3' HR
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 DRLPRO 08 A P RIG SERVICE
13:30 - 17:00 3.50 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/3001'- 3349' 348 TOTAL @ 99.4' HR
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 DRLPRO 09 A P SURVEY @ 3273' 2.04 DEG
17:30 - 0:00 .50 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 3349'- 3884' 545' TOTAL @ 83.8' HR { SWEEPING HOLE
)
10/26/2008 SUPERVISOR: TIM OXNER MD: 5,602
0:00 - 4:30 4,50 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 3894' - 4328' 435' TOTAL @ 96.6' HR
430 - 500 0.50 DRLPRO 09 A P SURVEY @ 4254' 2.58' DEG
5:00 - 15:00 10.00 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/4329' - 5087' 758' TOTAL @ 75.8' HR
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 DRLPRO 06 A P RIG SERVICE
15130 - 0:00 8.50 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 5087' - 5602' 515’ TOTAL @ 80.5 HR 34 VIS/10.2 MW
10/27/2008 SUPERVISOR: TiM OXNER MD: 5,986
0:00 - 5:00 5.00 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 5602' - 5845' 243' TOTAL @ 48.6' HR
5:00 - 5:30 0.50 DRLPRO 09 A P SURVEY @ 5771' 2.80 DEG
5:30 - 15:30 10.00 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 5845' - 6480' 635' TOTAL @ 63.5' HR
15:30 - 18:00 0.50 DRLPRO 06 A P RIG SERVICE
16:00 - 0:00 8.00 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 6480' - 6386' 508' TOTAL @ 63.2' HR 36 VIS/ 11.1 MW
10/28/2008 SUPERVISOR: TIM OXNER/JAMES GOBER MD: 7,485
0:00 - 2:30 2.50 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 6986'- 7119" 133' TOTAL @ 53.2 HR
2:30 - 3:30 1.00 DRLPRO 04 D S HOLE TAKING FLUID. LOST 47 BBLS. PICK UP & CIRC @ 90
SPM,MIX LCM TO 3%,REGAIN FULL RETURNS @ 120 SPM
3:30 - 830 5.00 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/7119'- 7365' 246' TOTAL @ 49.2' HR
8:30 - 10:00 1.50 DRLPRO 04 c P CIRC,MIX & PUMP PILL.DROP SURVEY.
10:00 - 15:30 5.50 DRLPRO 05 A P TOCH F/ BIT # 2,TIGHT HOLE COMING OF BOTTOM, TOOH, LAY
DOWN IBS. RETRIEVE SURVEY 7300' = 1.81 DEGREES.
FUNCTION BOP'S
15:30 - 21:00 5.50 DRLPRO 05 A P HOLD SAFETY MEETING, MAKE UP BIT #2 AND TRIP IN HOLE,
FILL PIPE @ 4000'. TRIP TO 7330 NO TIGHT HOLE. NO LOSSES
ON TRIP.
21:00 - 21:30 0.50 DRLPRO 03 D P FILL PIPE AND WASH 7330' TO 7365'.
21:30 - 23:00 1.50 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILLF/7365 TO 7453' (88", 58/HR)
23:00 - 23:30 0.50 DRLPRO 08 A P RIG SERVICE.
23:30 - 0:00 0.50 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 7453 TO 7485". (32", 64/HR) MUD WT 11.5 VIS 38
11/26/2008 8:21:47AM 3



Wins No.: 95084 HATCH 923-24M APl No.: 4904736869 l
10/28/2008 SUPERVISOR: JAMES GOBER MD: 8174
0:00 - 12:00 12.00 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 7485' TO 8021 (536", 457HR) MUD WT 11.8 VIS 42
12:00 - 12:30 0.50 DRLPRO 06 A P RIG SERVICE, FUNCTION BOP'S
12:30 - 0:00 11.50 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL FROM 8021' TO 8174' (153, 13/HR) MUD WT 11.8 VIS 42
10/30/2008 SUPERVISOR: JAMES GOBER MD: 8,290
0:00 - 800 8.00 DRLPRO 02 B P DRILL F/ 8174’ TO 8230" (116", 14.5VHR) TD 10/30/2008 08:00,
MUD WT 11.9 VIS 48
8:00 - g:30 1.50 DRLPRO 04 A P CIRC AND COND HOLE. PUMP DRY 40 BBL 13.5% DRY JOB.
9:30 - 11:30 2.00 DRLPRO 05 E p SHORT TRIP TO 7100". NO TIGHT HOLE. NO LOSSES NO GAINS
. TRIP GAS 720u
11:30 - 14:00 2.50 DRLPRO 04 A P SAFETY MEETING ,CIRC AND CONDITION HOLE, PUMP DRY 60
BBLS OF 13.8# MUD. DROP SURVEY.
14:00 - 19:00 5.00 DRLPRO 05 A P TOOH FOR LOGS, 1 DC AND 1 MUD MOTOR. RETRIEVE SURVEY
TOOL. 8200'= 2.42 DEGREES.
19:00 - 0:00 5.00 DRLPRO 08 A HOLD SAFETY MEETING AND RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER
LOGGERS. RUN TRIPLE COMBO. LOGGERS DEPTH 8296
HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE.
10/31/2008 SUPERVISOR: JAMES GOBER T MD: 8,290
0:00 - 3:00 3.00 EVALPR 08 A P RUN TRIPLE COMBO W/ SCHLUMBERGER. LOGGERS DEPTH
8296'. WELL CONDITION GOOD
3:00 - 14:00 11.00 EVALPR 08 A P RUN MONO-POLE AND CROSS- DIPOLE LOGS. LOGGERS
DEPTH 8296', WELL CONDITION GOOD.
14:00 - 20:30 6.50 EVALPR 08 A P RUN VSP LOG. LOGGER DEPTH @ 8298". END VSP LOG DUE
TO POOR TOOL WELLBORE COUPLING. VSP WILL BE RUN
INSIDE OF PRODUCTION CSG AT LATER DATE. RIG DOWN
SCHLUMBERGER. WELL COND. GOOD.
20:30 - 0:.00 3.50 EVALPR 05 E P TRIP IN HOLE W/ TRI- CONE BIT. BREAK CIRC @ 2200, 4700". .
TRIPPING IN HOLE @ 5000
11/1/2008 SUPERVISOR: JAMES GOBER oo MD; 8,250
0:00 - 2:00 2.00 DRLPRO 05 A P TRIP IN HOLE, BRIDGE OUT @ 7720.
2:00 - 2:30 0.50 DRLPRO 03 A P WASH AND REAM TIGHT HOLE. 7720' TO 7750".
2:30 - 3:00 0.50 DRLPRO 05 A P TRIP TO BOTTOM.
3:00 - 400 1.00 DRLPRO 04 o] P CIRC OUT GAS. HIGH GAS= 6750 u. HOLD SAFETY MEETING W/
TESCO LAYDOWN AND RIG UP LAYDOWN TRUCK.
4:00 - 11:00 7.00 DRLPRO 05 A P LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE.
11:00 - 12:30 1.50 MAINT 07 A Z  TONG HEAD PIN WAS SEIZED UP IN TONGS. USED WELDER TO
REMOVE PIN
12:30 - 15:30 3.00 DRLPRO 05 A P BREAK KELLY, AND LAY DOWN BHA.
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 CsG 11 A P HOLD SAFETY MEETING, RIG UP CSG CREW.
11/26/2008 8:21:47AM 4



Wins No.: 95084

HATCH 923-24M

APINo.:

16:00 - 22:30

22:30 - 0:00

1.50

CsG

CsG

11

04

B

P

RUN IN HOLE W/ 4.5" 1-80, 11.6# . RUN CSG TO THE DEPTH OF
8284'KB, BREAK CIRC 1000' AND 5000'. MARKER JT WILL LAND
@ 4262' KB, TAG BOTTOM 8290", MAKE UP FMC LANDING JT
AND MANDREL.

INSTALL BJ CEMENTING HEAD AND BALES, CIRC DOWN CSG
W/ RIG, HOLD SAFETY MEETING. RIG DOWN TESCO CSG
CREW AND LAYDOWN TRUCK. CIRC OUT GAS. HOLD SAFETY
MEETING W/ BJ SERVICES.

11/2/2008

SUPERVISOR:
0:00 - 2:00

2:00 - 2:30

2:30 - 9:30

JAMES GOBER
3.00

0.50

7.00

CsG

CsG

CSG

15

13

MD: 8,280

PUMP 20 BBLS MUD CLEAN, PUMP 30 BBLS (20 SX) OF 9.5%
SCAVENGER PREM LIGHT CEMENT, PUMP 188 BBLS (350 SX)
OF 11.3# LEAD PREM LIGHT CEMENT. PUMP 268 BBLS (1150 SX)
14.3# TAIL 50/50 POZ CEMENT. DISPLACE W/ 126.83 BBLS OF
8.3# H20 W/ MAGNACIDE. LOST RETURNS W/ 30 BBLS OF
SCAVENGER TO PIT. LIFT PRESSURE 2070 @ 2.4 RATE.
BUMPED PLUG 2640 PSI, TEST FLOAT FLOAT HELD.

LAND CSG W/ 80,000#, FLUSH STACK AND LAY DOWN LANDING
JT. TEST MANDREL TO 5000 PSI FOR 5 MIN.

NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S AND CLEAN PITS (EXTRA HRS FOR
CLEANING PIT, PITS HAD HIGH VOLUME OF CUTTINGS DUE TO
LOSS CIRC.) RELEASE RIG 11/02/2008 09:30

11/26/2008

B8:21:47AM

4904736869




Wins No.: 95084 o HATCH 923-24M APINo.: 490473686§ﬂ
EVENT INFORMATION: EVENT ACTIVITY: COMPLETION START DATE: 11/20/2008 AFE NO.: 2013628
OBJECTIVE: DEVELOPMENT END DATE:
OBJECTIVE 2; ORIGINAL DATE WELL STARTED PROD.:
REASON: Event End Status:
RIG OPERATIONS: Begin Mobilization ~ Rig On Location  Rjg Charges  Rig Operation Start  Finish Drilling Rig Release  Rig Off Location
LEED 698 / 698
Date Time Duration Phase Code | Subco P/U Operation
Start-End (hr) de
11/20/2008 SUPERVISOR: BRAD BURMAN MD;
7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P JSA#1
7:30 - 17:00 9.50 COMP 30 A P [DAY 1] RDMO BONANZA 1023-4FX. ROAD RIG TO HATCH
923-24M. MIRU, SPOT EQUIPMENT. NDWH, NUBOP. R/U FLOOR
& TBG EQUIPMENT. P/U 3-7/8" MILL & RiH ON NEW 2-3/8" J-55
TBG. [SLM) TBG WAS DRIFTED.
TAG HARD @ 8218
4 PM SWI-SDFN. PREP TO C/O TO PBTD, P.T. & PERF IN AM.
11/21/2008 SUPERVISOR: BRAD BURMAN MD:
8:00 - 820 0.50 COMP 48 P-  JSA#2
8:30 - 15:00 6.50 COMP 33 8AM [DAY 2] JSA#2
EOT @ 8218". R/U SWVL & PMP. ESTABLISH CIRCULATION W/
RIG PUMP. DRILL & C/O 23' HARD CMT TO PBTD @ 8241".
CIRCULATE WELL CLN W/ 140 BBLS. R/D SWVL. POOH & L/D 16
JTS ON FLOAT. CONTINUE POOH STDG BACK TBG. LD MILL.
NDBOP, NU FRAC VALVES.
MIRU DBL JACK. P.T. CSG & FRAC VALVES TO 7500#. RDMO
DBL JACK.
[STG#1] MIRU CUTTERS. RIH W/ PERF GUNS & PERF THE M.V.
@ B8178'-8182' & 8226'-8232' USING 3-3/8" EXP GUNS, 23 GM, 0.35,
90* PHS, 4 SPF, [40 HLS] WHP=0#. POOH & L/D WIRELINE
TOOLS. RDMO CUTTERS.
3 PM SWI-SDF-WE PREP TO FRAC W/ BJ ON MONDAY 11/24/08
11/24/2008 SUPERVISOR: BRAD BURMAN MD:
500 - 530 0.50 COMP 48 P HLDBJJSA

11/26/2008 8:21:47AM




Wins No.: 95084  HATCH923-24M APINo.. 4904736869 |
530 - 5:30 0.00 COMP 36 E P [DAY 3] MIRU BJ & CUTTERS. P.T. SURFACE LINES TO 8080#.

[STG#1] WE-SICP=730. BRK DN PERFS @ 3621# @ 4 BPM.
1SIP=2488, FG=.75. BULLHEAD 3 BBLS 15% HCL. CALC ALL
PERFS OPEN. PMP'D 905 BBLS SLK WTR & 31,826% 40/70 SD W/
5000# R.C. SD @ TAIL. ISIP=2156, FG=.70, NPI=-332, MP=5453,
MR=54, AP=4830, AR=53 BPM.

[STG#2] RIH W/ BAKER 8K CBP & PERF GUNS. SET CBP @ 8116.
PERF THE M.V. @ 8009'-8012', B062-8066" & 8033™-8086" USING
3-3/8" EXP GUNS, 23 GM, 0.36, 90" PHS, 4 SPF, {40 HLS]
WHP=1840. BRK DN PERFS @ 2525 @ 4 BPM. |SIP=2108, FG=.70.
CALC ALL PERFS OPEN, PMP'D 2264 BBLS SLK WTR & 86,356#
40/70 SD W/ 5000# R.C. SAND @ TAIL. ISIP=2378, FG=.74,
NPi=270, MP=4714, MR=58, AP=4571, AR=57 BPM.

[STG#3] RIH W/ BAKER 8K CBP & PERF GUNS. SET CBP @ 7920".
PERF THE M.V. @ 7796'-7798' & 7882'-7890' USING 3-3/8" EXP
GUNS, 23 GM, 0.35, 90* PHS, 4 SPF, [40 HLS] WHP= 2070. BRK
DN PERFS @ 2183 @ 2 BPM. I1SIP=2048, FG=.70. CALC ALL
PERFS OPEN. PMP'D 2343 BBLS SLK WTR & 89,486# 40/70 SAND
W/ 5000# R.C. SAND @ TAIL. IS1P=2656, FG=.78, NPI=607,
MP=5868, MR=58, AP=5118, AR=50 BPM.

[STG#4] RIH W/ BAKER 8K CBP & PERF GUNS. SET CBP @ 7694".
PERF THE M.V. @ 7596'-7599' & 7657'-7664' USING 3-3/8" EXP
GUNS, 23 GM, 0.38, 90* PHS, 4 SPF, [40 HLS] WHP=2133# BRK
DN PERFS @ 2872# @ 4 BPM. ISIP=2320, FG=.75. CALC 14/40
THEN 28/40 PERFS OPEN WHEN SD HIT. PMP'D 1859 BBLS SLK
WTR & 58,527# 40/70 SAND W/ NO R.C. @ TAIL. I151P=2833,
FG=.81, NPI=513, MP=6256, MR=50, AP=5634, AR=46 BPM. CUT
SAND EARLY. WANTING TO SCREEN OUT. GOT FLUSHED OK.
STG DESIGN FOR 84K SAND. 27 K SAND SHORT.

[STG#5) RiH W/ BAKER 8K CBP & PERF GUNS. SET CBP @ 7439".
PERF THE M.V. @ 7414'-7418"' & 7457'-7463' USING 3-3/8" EXF
GUNS, 23 GM, 0.36, 90* PHS, 4 SPF, [40 HLS] WHP= 21# BRK DN
PERFS @ 2724 @ 4 BPM. ISIP=1757, FG=.68. CALC ALL PERFS
OPEN. PMP'D 1883 BBLS SLKWTR & 70,014# 40/70 SAND W/
5000# R.C. SAND @ TAIL. ISIP=2123, FG=.73, NP|=366, MP=4305,
MR=58, AP=3913, AR=57 BPM.

[STG#5] RIH W/ BAKER 8K CBP & PERF GUNS. SET CBP @ 7356".
PERF THE M.V. @ 7222'-7226', 7286'-7294' & 7324'-7326' USING
3-3/8" EXP GUNS, 23 GM, 0.36, 120" PHS, 3 SPF, [42 HLS] WHP=
214#. BRK DN PERFS @ 1340# @ 3 BPM. ISIP=1261, FG=.62.
CALC ALL PERFS OPEN. PMP'D 4817 BBLS SLK WTR & 208,522#
40/70 SAND W/ 5000# R.C. SAND @ TAIL. ISIP=1754, FG=.88,
NPi=493, MP=4454, MR=58, AP=3874, AR=57 BPM.

IKILL PLUG] RIH W/ AKER 8K CBP & SET @ 7192'. POOH & LD
WIRELINE TOOLS. RDMO CUTTERS & BJ. GRAND TOTAL 40/70
& R.C. SAND PMP'D=540,831# & TOTAL FLUID=14,171 BBLS.

6 PM SWI-SDFN. FREEZE PROTECT W.H. PREP TO D/O 6 CBP'S
IN AM

11/25/2008 SUPERVISOR: BRAD BURMAN . MD:
7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P JSA#5

11/26/2008 B8:21:47AM 7



Wins No.:

95084

HATCH 923-24M _ , APINo.: 4904736869

7:30 - 18:00 10.50 COMP

44

[DAY 4] ND FRAC VALVES, NUBOP. R/U FLOOR & TBG
EQUIPMENT. P/U 3-7/8" BIT, POBS W/ XN & RiH OUT OF
DERRICK ON 2-3/8" TBG. TAG CBP#1 @ 7182". R/U SWVL & RIG
PMP. ESTABLISH CIRCULATION W/ RIG PMP. P.T. BOP TO
3000#. [HELD GOOD]

[DRLG CBP#1] @ 7192". D/O BAKER 8K CBP IN 4 MIN. 175# INC.
RIH, TAG SD @ 7326'. C/O 30" SD. FCP=150%.

[DRLG CBP#2] @ 7356'. D/O BAKER 8K CBP IN 4 MIN. 100# INC.
RIH, TAG SD @ 7453'. C/O 40' SD. FCP=200#.

[DRLG CBP#3] @ 7483. D/O BAKER 8K CBP IN 5 MIN. 25 INC.
RIH, TAG SD @ 7664". C/O 30' SD. FCP=225#.

[DRLG CBP#4] @ 7694'. D/O BAKER CBP IN 5 MIN. 25# INC. RIH,
TAG SD @ 7890". C/O 30' SD. FCP=235#.

[DRLG CBP#5] @ 7920'. D/O BAKER 8K CBP IN 6 MIN. 25# INC.
RIH, TAG SD @ 8088'. C/O 30' SD. FCP=250#.

[DRLG CBP#56] @ 8116'. D/O BAKER 8K CBP IN 6 MIN. 25# INC.
RIH, TAG SD @ 8231'. C/0 10" SD TO PBTD @ 8241'. CIRC WELL
CLN. R/D SWVL. POOH & L/D 38 JTS ON FLOAT. LAND TBG ON
HNGR W/ 225 JTS NEW 2-3/8" J-55 TBG. GUALD HANGER
THREADS. CALL FMC FOR THREAD CHASER. NDBOP. WORK
ON CLEANING UP THREADS. NUBOP. UNLAND TBG & CHANGE
OUT TBG HANGER. EOT @ 7056.08' & POBS W/ XN @ 7053.88".
[LANDED TBG ABOVE T.P. FOR LATER PROD LOG] AVG 5
MIN/PLUG & C/O 180° SAND. R/D FLOOR & TBG EQUIP. NDBOP,
NUWH. DROP BALL DN TBG & PMP OFF THE BIT @ 2200#. OPEN
WELL TO FBT ON 20/64 CHOKE. FTP=1200, SICP=1450.

8 PM TURN WELL OVER TO FBC. LTR @ 6 PM=12,281 BBLS.
RACK EQUIP.

NOTE:

270 JTS DELV

225 LANDED

44 RETURNED. 1 BAD ON GRND.

11/26/2008

SUPERVISOR: BRAD BURMAN
7:.00 -

33

MD:

7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 1550#, TP 1400#, 20/64" CK, 62 BWPH,
TRACE SAND, - GAS

TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 2846

BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER: 11325

11/26/2008

8:21:47AM
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Form 3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 2007) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004-0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: July 31,2010
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND L.OG 5. LJ%SJSSO%%NO-
la. Type of Well 0 Ol Well B Gas Well O Dry O Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion X New Well 0 Work Over O Deepen O Plug Back [3 Diff. Resvr.
Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.
er
2. Name of Operator Contact: SHEILA UPCHEGO 8. Lease Name and Well No.
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE-Mail: sheila.upchego@anadarko.com HATCH 923-24M
3. Address 1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. API Well No.
VERNAL, UT 84078 Ph: 435-781-7024 43-047-36869
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)* 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
! UNDESIGNATED
Atsurface SWSW 508FSL 823FWL T1. Seo, T., R, M., or Block and Survey
At top prod interval reported below ~ SWSW 508FSL 823FWL or Area_Sec 24 T9S R23E Mer SLB
) 12. County or Parish 13. State
Attotal depth SWSW 508FSL 823FWL UINTAH uT
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed 17. Elevations (DF, KB, RT, GL)*
09/08/2008 11/02/2008 OD&A [ Ready to Prod. 5200 GL
11/27/2008
18. Total Depth: MD 8290 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 8241 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD
TVD TVD TVD
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Was well cored? X No O Yes (Submit analysis)
CBL-CCL-GR ; & < i + 4 N ) Was DST run? B No O Yes (Submit analysis)
! Ss‘ﬁiC SCCGWW. E\ﬁs Directional Survey? [ No O Yes (Submit analysis)
23, Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)
. . § Top Bottom |Stage Cementer| No. of Sks. & Sharry Vol. N
Hole Size Size/Grade Wt (#/0) (MD) MD) Depth Type of Cement (BBL) Cement Top Amount Pulled
20.000 14.000 STEEL 36.7 40 28
12.250 9.625 J-55 36.0 2250 700
7.875 4.500 1-80 11.6 8290 1500

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)

2.375 7056
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A) MESAVERDE 7222 8232 7222 TO 8232 0.360 242]OPEN
B)
9]
D)

27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
7222 TO 8232} PMP 14,171 BBLS SLICK H20 & 540,831# 30/50 SD

28. Production - Interval A

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production |BBL MCE BBL Corr. API Gravity

11/27/2008 | 11/16/2008 24 _> 0.0 1085.0 550.0 FLOWS FROM WELL
Choke Thg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Qil Gas Water Gas:0il Well Status
Size Flwg. 605 | Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

20064 |st 12260 |—=| o 1085 550 PGW

28a, Production - Interval B
Date First Test Hours Test 0il Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production | BBL MCF BBL Corr. APL Gravity
Choke Thbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. il Gas Water Gas:0il Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI —

(See Instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side) . R EC E iVED
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #65935 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED **

JAN 05 2009
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



28b. Production - Interval C

Date First Test Hours Test 0il Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production | BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas:0il Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
s1 e
28c. Production - Interval D
Date First Test Hours Test Qil Gas Water QOil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production |BBL MCF BBL Corr. APL Gravity
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Qil Gas Water Gas:0il Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
SI —

29. Disposition of Gas(Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc.)
SOLD

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31, Formation (Log) Markers
q

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, efc. Name | Too
Meas. Depth
GREEN RIVER 1382
MAHOGANY 2114
WASATCH 4302 6032
MESAVERDE 6092 8270

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

33, Circle enclosed attachments:

1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey

5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 6. Core Analysis 7 Other:

34. ] hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions):

Electronic Submission #65935 Verified by the BLM Well Information System.
For KERR-MCGEE OIL. & GAS ONSHORE L, sent to the Vernal

Name (please pring) SHEILABRCHEGO P’ Title OPERATIONS
y /7 /

-

Signature Date 12/30/2008

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency
of the United States any false, fictitious or fradulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL **
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