
EOG Resources, Inc.
P.O. 1910

Vernal, UT 84078

June 27, 2005

Utah Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

RE: APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
EAST CHAPITA 11-4
NW/SE, SEC. 4, T9S, R23E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE NO.: U-01304
FEDERAL LANDS

Enclosed please find a copy of the Application for Permit to Drill and associated
attachments for the referenced well.

Please address further communication regarding this matter (including approval) to:
Ed Trotter
P.O. Box 1910
Vernal, UT 84078
Phone: (435)789-4120
Fax: (435)789-1420

Sincerely,

'Ed Trotte
Agent
EOG Resources, Inc.

Attachments

JULO6 2005

East Chapita 11-4



Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) OMB No. 1004-0137

Expires March 31, 2007
UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT U-01304

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER

7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.
la. Type of Work: DRILL REENTER

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Ib. Type of Well: OHWen Gas Well Ü Other Ü Single Zone Multiple Zone EAST CHAPITA 11-4
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

EOG RESOURCES, INC. n -T.Î047- JC ÿt5
3a. Address P.O. BOX 1815 3b. Phone No. (Include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

VERNAL, UT 84078 (435)789-0790 NATURAL BUTTES
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk. and Survey or Area

At surface 1815' FSL, 1969' FEL /SE SEC. 4, T9S, R23E,
At proposed prod. Zone ; c4. yggq ¡ y S.L.B.& M.

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State
27.1 MILES SOUTHEAST OF OURAY, UTAH UINTAH UTAH

15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
location to nearest 1815' 40property or lease line, ft 2451

(Also to nearest drig. Unit line, if any)

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, drilling, completed,

« NM-2308
applied for, on this lease, ft. See Topo Map c 9400

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate datework will start* 23. Esti mated duration
4971.5 FEET GRADED GROUND UPON APPROVAL | 45 DAYS

24. Attachments
Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file
2. A Drilling Plan. (see Item 20 above).
3. A Surface UsePlan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required
by theauthorized officer.

I I I

25. Signature Name (Printed/TJped) Date

Title

Ed Trotter June 27, 2005

Agent
Appro . Name (Printed/Tuned) ' Date

BRADLEYG. HILL
ENVIRONMENTALSCIENTISTIII - Ù

l
e . Office

I

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to
conduct operations thereon.
Conditions of Approval, if any, are attached.

DECElvEOTitle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
* (Instructions on page 2)

Fempyrovalof thie P" OlL,GAS&MININGAction is NecessefY



EOG RESOURCES,INC.T9S R23E S.L.B.&M ' Well location, EAST CHAPITA #11-4, located os
shown in the NW 1/4 SE 1/4 of Section 4,TBS S89°55'E

- 5280.00' (G.L.O.) T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. Uintoh County, Utah.
T9S BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK 58 EAM (1965) LOCATED IN THE NE 1/4 OF
d SECTION 30. T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE RED

LOT 4 LOT 3 LOT 2 LOT 1 -3 WASH SE, QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5
, MINUTEQUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL
SURVEY. SAID ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 5132 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.I

o o
1977 Brass CoA

NI 2° High, PJe 1977 Brass Cep,
of Stones O S' High

o oo o oEAST CHAPITA/11-4 ages ° °

Elev. Ungraded Ground = 497J'

CERTIFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THÛABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYSMADEBY ME ÓR µNDER MY
SUPERVISION AND THAT THESAMEARE TRUE ANDCORRECT TO THE,
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BEUEF

1977 Brass Cpp, 1977 Brass Cap, 1977 Brass CW,
- .REGlŠTERED LAND SU OR0.5 High, Pile 12' High, 2x4 10' Hsph, Steel .RE

ISTRATION NO. 161319of Stones Post si
STA1ÇÓ UTAH.,-SB9°47'52"W

- 2632 87' (Meas ) S89 587 J~W
- 2643.94' (Meas )

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
BS SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

(435) 789-1017
(NAD 83)LEGEND SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATEDRAWN:LATITUDE=

40°03'45.77" (40.062714) 1" =
1000° 05-25-05 06-02-05

= 90 SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109°19°46.69"
(109.329636) PARTY REFERENCES(NAD 27) T.B. B.C. P.M- G.L.O. PLAT= PROPOSED WELL HEAD LATITUDE =

40°03°45.89° (40.062747) WEATHER FILEA = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE= 10919°44.24"
(109.328956) COOL EOG RESOURCES.



EIGHT POINT PLAN
EAST CHAPITA 11-4

NW/SE, SEC. 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION DEPTH (KB)
Green River 1,963'
C-Zone 2,238'
Mahogany Oil Shale Bed 2,593'
Middle Carb Bed 3,373'
Castle Peak MBR 4,593'
Uteland Butte MBR 4,743'
Wasatch 4,857'
Chapita Wells 5,470'
Buck Canyon 6,150'
North Horn 6,773'
Island 7,184'
KMV Price River 7,325'
KMV Price River Middle 7,977'
KMV Price River Lower 8,785'
Sego 9,197'

Estimated TD: 9,400' or 200'± below Sego top Anticipated BHP: 5,133 Psig

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: Production Hole - 5000 Psig
BOP schematic diagrams attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:
RATING FACTOR

HOLE SIZE INTERVAL LENGTH &I_ZE WEIÇHT ÇRADE THREAD CQLLAPSE BÇR$T TENSILE
12-1/4" O' - 2,300'KB± 2,300'± 9-¾" 36.0# J-55 ST&C 2020 Psi 3520 Psi 394,000#
7-7/8" 2,300'± - TD 9,400± 4-½" 11.6# N-80 LT&C 6350 Psi 7780 Psi 223,000#

12-¼" surface hole will be drilled to a total depth of 200'± below the base of the Green
River lost circulation zone and cased w/9-%" as shown to that depth. Drilled depth may be
shallower or deeper than the 2300' shown above depending on the actual depth of the loss zone.

All casing will be new or inspected.

5. Float Eauioment:
Surface Hole Procedure (0'-2300'±)
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Centralizers: 1-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5* jointto surface. (15 total)

8 point plan-EOG \



EIGHT POINT PLAN ~

EAST CHAPITA 11-4
NWISE, SEC. 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

Float Eauioment: (Cont'd)
Production Hole Procedure (2300'±- TD):

Float shoe, 1 jointcasing, float collar and balance of casing to surface. 4-1/2", 11.6#, N-80 or equivalent
marker collars or short casing joints to be placed at top of Price River and 400' above top of Wasatch.
Centralizers to be placed 5' above shoe on joint #1, top of joint #2, and every 2nd joint to 400' above
Wasatch Island top. (50± total). Thread lock float shoe, top and bottom of float collar, and top of 2nd

joint.

6. MUD PROGRAM
Surface Hole Procedure (Surface - 2300'±):
Airlair mist or aerated water.

Production Hole Procedure (2300'±- TD): Anticipated mud weight 9.5 - 10.5 ppg depending on
actual wellbore conditions encountered while drilling.

2300'± - TD A closed mud system will be utilized. A bentonite gelled water mud system will be used
to control viscosity w/PHPA polymer used for supplemental viscosity and clay
encapsulationlinhibition. Water loss will be maintained at <15cc's using white starch or
PAC. Bactericides will be used as needed. Anticipated pH will range from 9.0-10.0.
Mud weight will be adjusted as necessary for well control. Deflocculants/thinners will be
used as necessary to maintain mud quality. LCM sweeps will be utilized as necessary to
control lost circulation and mud loss. CO2 contamination, if encountered, will be treated
with lime and gypsum.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:
EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.
To reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be approximately 75' in length.

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:
Logs: Mud log from base of surface casing to TD. Cased hole evaluation logs will be run in lieu of

open hole logs.

8 point plan-EOG 2



EIGHT POINT PLAN -

EAST CHAPITA 11-4
NW/SE, SEC. 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:
Surface Hole Procedure (Surface - 2300'±):
Lead: Class "G" cement with 16% Gel, 10 #/sx Gilsonite, 3% Salt, 2% CaCI2,3 lb/sx GR3 ¼ #/sx

Flocele mixed at 11 ppg, 3.82 ft'/sk. yield, 23 gps water.

Tail: Class "G" cement with 2% CaCI2, ¼#lsk Flocele mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 ft'/sk., 5.2 gps
water.

Top Out: As necessary with Class "G" cement with 2% CaCI2, ¼#/sk Flocele mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18
ft3/sk., 5.2 gps water.

Note: Cement volumes will be calculated to bring lead cement to surface and tail cement to
500'above the casing shoe.

Production Hole Procedure (2300'± - TD)
Lead: 410 sks: 35:65 Poz "G" w/4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% D174 (Extender), 0.2% D65

(Dispersant),0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% Dl12 (Fluid Loss Additive , 0.200%
Dl3 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29 (cello flakes) mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.75 ft /sk., 9.19
gps water.

Tail: 725 sks: 50:50 Poz "G" w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.075% D13
(Retarder), 0.2% D167 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at
14.1 ppg, 1.28 ft'/sk., 5.9gps water.

Note: Number of sacks is based on gauged holecalculation.
Lead volume to be calculated to bring cement to 200'± above 9-5/8" casing shoe. Tail
volume to be calculated to bring cement to 400'± above top of Wasatch.

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:
Surface Hole (Surface - 2300'±):
Lost circulation

Production Hole (2300'±- TD):
Sloughing shales, lost circulation and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch Formation.

8 point plan-EOG 3



EIGHT POINT PLAN -

EAST CHAPITA 11-4
NWISE, SEC. 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this
well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning
quantities, will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this
well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG 4



5000 PSIG DIAGRAM

ANNULAR PREVENTOR AND BOTH RAMS ARE 5000 PSIG RATED.
CASING FLANGE IS 11" 5000 PSIG RATED. ROTATING HEAD
BOPE 11 000 PES

URE: OW LINE
1. BOPE's will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2 ( )

with retest every 14 days.
2. Blind & Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5000 psig.

\¯
I

3. Annular preventor will be tested to 50% of working pressure, 2500 psig.
4. Casing will be tested to 0.22 psilft or 2500 psig. Not to exceed 70% of burst ANNULAR

strength, whichever is greater. PREVENTER

5. All lines subject to well pressure will be pressure-tested to the same pressure as
blind & pipe rams.

6. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2
requirements for 5000 psig BOPE specifications.

IBLIND OR PIPE RAMS
CHOKE MANIFOLD

2" MIN ADJUSTABLE CHOKE I I
0 0 09

I I
TO MUDIGAS SEPARATOR
OR PIT BLIND OR PIPE RAMS

* * 3" MINIMUM RATED O
5000 PSIG

3" MINIMUM | 2" KILL LINE

o C×0 0 3 I
BLEED LINE TO PIT 3" DIAMETER

CASING

2" MINIMUM LANG

SPOOL 11" 5000 PSIG

TO MUDIGAS SEPARATOR ADJUSTABLE CHOKE
OR PIT (Note: Blind Rams may be installed above or below the pipe



CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
FOR THE SURFACE USE PROGRAM OF THE

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
Well Name & Number: East Chapita 11-4
Lease Number: U-01304
Location: 1815' FSL & 1969' FEL, NWISE, Sec. 4,

T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M., Uintah County, Utah
Surface Ownership: Federal

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction
of location and access roads.

Location Completion - prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Spud Notice: - at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to
spudding the well.

Casing String and
Cementing - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and cementing all casing strings.

BOP and related
Equipment Tests - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and tests.

First Production
Notice - within five (5) business days after new

Well begins or production resumes after
Well has been off production for more
than ninety (90) days.

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of
Approval for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

East Chapita 11-4 D



THIRTEEN POINT SURFACE USE PROGRAM

1. EXISTING ROADS

A. See attached Wellsite Plats showing directional reference stakes on location,
and attached TOPO Map "B" showing access to location from existing roads.

B. The proposed well site is located approximately 27.1 miles southeast of
Ouray, Utah - See attached TOPO Map "A".

C. Refer to attached Topographic Map "A" showing labeled access route to
location.

D. Existing roads will be maintained and repaired as necessary. No off lease
Right-of-Way will be required.

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROAD

A. The access road will be approximately 20 feet in length. See attached TOPO
Map "B".

B. The access road has a 30 foot ROW w/ 18 foot running surface.
C. Maximum grade on access road will be 8%.
D. No turnouts will be required.
E. Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing

type.
F. No culverts, bridges, or major cuts and fills will be required.
G. The access road will be dirt surface.
H. No gates, cattleguards, or fences will be required or encountered.

New or reconstructed roads will be centerlined - flagged at time of location
staking.

The road shall be upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated traffic flow
and all-weather road requirements. Upgrading shall include ditching, drainage, graveling,
crowning, and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well-constructed safe road.
Prior to upgrading, the road shall be cleared of any snow cover and allowed to dry
completely. Traveling off the 30 foot Right-of-Way will not be allowed.

Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing type.
Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause siltation or accumulation of debris in
the drainage crossings nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Erosion of
drainage ditches by run off water shall be prevented by diverting water off at frequent
intervals by means of cutouts. Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions.
Should mud holes develop, they shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.

As operator, EOG Resources, Inc. shall be responsible for all maintenance on
cattleguards, or gates associated with this oil and/or gas operation.

East Chapita i 1-4 D



3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A ONE MILE RADIUS OF
PROPOSED WELL LOCATION

None (See attached TOPO map "C").

4. LOCATION OF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED FACILITIES

A. ON WELL PAD

1. Production facilities will be set on location if the well is successfully
completed for production. Facilities will consist of wellhead valves,
combo separator-dehy unit with meter, 300 Bbl vertical or 200 Bbl low
profile, condensate tank, and attaching piping.

2. Gas gathering lines - A 4" gathering line will be buried from dehy to
the edge of the location.

B. OFF WELL PAD

1. Proposed location of attendant off pad flowlines shall be flagged prior
to archaeological clearance.

2. A 4" OD steel above ground natural gas pipeline will be laid
approximately 18' from proposed location to a point in the NWISE of
Section 4, T9S, R23E, where it will tie into QuestarPipeline Co.'s
existing line. Proposed pipeline crosses Federal lands, thus a Right-of
-Way grant will be required.

3. Proposed pipeline will be a 4" OD steel, welded line laid on the
surface.

4. Protective measures and devices for livestock and wildlife will be
taken and/or installed where required.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the well pad shall be surrounded by a containment dike
of sufficient capacity to contain, at a minimum, the entire contents of the
largest tank within the facility/battery.

The production facilities will be placed on the West side of the location.

All permanent (on site for six months or longer) structures constructed or
installed (including pumping units) will be painted a flat, non-reflective,
earthtone color to match one of the standard environmental colors, as
determined by the Rocky Mountain Five State Interagency Committee.
All facilities will be painted within 6 months of installation. Facilities
required to comply with O.S.H.A. (Occupational Safety and Health Act)
will be excluded.

East Chapita 11-4 D



The required paint color is Carlsbad Canyon.

If at any time the facilities located on public land and authorized by the
terms of the lease are no longer included in the lease (due to a contraction
in the unit or other lease or unit boundary change), BLM will process a
change in authorization to the appropriate statute. The authorization will
be subject to appropriate rental or other financial obligation as determined
by the authorized officer.

5. LOCATION & TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

A. Water supply will be from Ouray Municipal Water Plant at Ouray, Utah,
and/or Target Trucking Inc.'s water source in the SW/SW, Sec. 35, T9S,
R22E, Uintah County, Utah (State Water Right #49-1501). Produced water
from the Chapita Wells and Stagecoach Units will also be used.

B. Water will be hauled by a licensed trucking company.
C. No water well will be drilled on lease.

6. SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL

A. All construction material for this location and access road will be of native
borrow and soil accumulated during the construction of the location.

B. All construction material will come from Federal Land.
C. No mineral materials will be required.

7. METHODS OF HANDLING WASTE DISPOSAL

A. METHODS AND LOCATION
1. Cuttings will be confined in the reserve pit.
2. A portable toilet will be provided forhuman waste duringthe drilling

and completion of the well. Disposal will be at the Vernal sewage
disposal plant.

3. Burning will not be allowed. Trash and other waste material will be
contained in a wire mesh cage and disposed of at the Uintah County
Landfill.

4. Produced wastewater will be confined to a lined pit or storage tank for
a period not to exceed 90 days after initial production. After the 90
day period, the produced water will be contained in a tank on location
and then disposed of at one of the following three locations: Natural
Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD, Ace Disposal, or EOG Resources, Inc.
drilling operations (Chapita Wells Unit, Natural Buttes Unit &
Stagecoach Unit).

5. All chemicals will be disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Drip
pans and absorbent pads will be used on the drilling rig to avoid
leakage of oil to the pit.

East Chapita 11-4 D



B. Water from drilling fluids and recovered during testing operations will be
disposed of by either evaporating in the reserve pit or be removed and
disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Introduction of well bore
hydrocarbons to the reserve pit will be avoided by flaring them off in the flare
pit at the time of recovery.

On BLM administered land:
The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.
If the reserve pit requires padding prior to lining (due to rocky conditions) felt
padding will be used.

The reserve pit shall be lined with felt and a 12 millimeter plastic liner.

8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES
A. No airstrips or camps are planned for this well.

9. WELLSITE LAYOUT
A. Refer to attached well site plat for related topography cuts and fills and

cross sections.
B. Refer to attached well site plat for rig layout and soil material stockpile

location as approved on On-site.
C. Refer to attached well site plat for rig orientation, parking areas, and

access road.
D. The approved seed mixture for this location is:

Four-Wing Salt Bush - 3 pounds per acre
Indian Rice Grass - 2 pounds per acre
Needle and Thread Grass - 2 pounds per acre
Hi-Crest Crested Wheat Grass - 1 pound per acre.

The reserve pit will be located on the Northwest comer of the location.
The flare pit will be located downwind of the prevailing wind direction on
the North side of the location, a minimum of 100 feet from the well head
and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.
The stockpiled pit topsoil will be stored separate from the location topsoil
Southwest of Comer #4. The stockpiled location topsoil will be stored
South of Comer #6, as well as between Comers 1 and 2. Upon completion
of construction, the stockpiled topsoil from the location will be broadcast
seeded with the approved seed mixture for this location and then walked
down with a Caterpiller tractor.

Access to the well pad will be from the Southeast.

Comers #2 & #6 will be rounded off to minimize excavation.

East Chapita 11-4 D



FENCING REQUIREMENTS:

All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

A. Thirty-nine inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of barbed wire
on top of the net wire. (Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of
reinforcement rod is attached to the top of the entire fence).

B. The net wire shall be no more than 2 inches above the ground. The barbed
wire strand shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence
shall be at least 42 inches.

C. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner as to keep the
fence tight at all times.

D. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

E. All wire shall be stretched by using a stretching device before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on the three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until clean-up.

Each existing fence to be crossed by the access road shall be braced and tied off
before cutting so as to prevent slacking of the wire. The opening shall be closed
temporarily as necessary during construction to prevent the escape of livestock,
and, upon completion of construction, the fence shall be repaired to BLM or SMA
specifications. A cattleguard with an adjacent 16 foot gate shall be installed in
any fence where a road is to be regularly traveled. If the well is a producer, the
cattleguards (shall/shall not) be permanently mounted on concrete bases. Prior to
crossing any fence located on Federal land, or any fence between Federal land and
private land, the operator will contact the BLM, who will in turn contact the
grazing permittee or owner of said fence and offer him/her the opportunity to be
present when the fence is cut in order to satisfy himself/herself that the fence is
adequately braced and tied off.

10. PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE

A. PRODUCING LOCATION
Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash, and junknot
required for production.
Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be
removed in accordance with CFR 3162.7-1.
If a plastic nylon reinforced liner is used, it shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

East Chapita I 1-4 D



The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production
facilities/operations will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours.
The stockpiled pit topsoil will then be spread over the pit area and broadcast
seeded with the prescribed seed mixture for this location. The seeded area will
then be walked down with a cat.

B. DRY HOLE/ABANDONED LOCATION

At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator will submit a
subsequent report of abandonment and the BLM will attach the appropriate
surface rehabilitation conditions of approval.

11. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
Access road: Federal
Location: Federal

12. OTHER INFORMATION
A. EOG Resources, Inc. will inform all persons in the area who are associated

with this project that they are subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing
historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or
archaeological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator will
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials, and contact
the AO. Within five working days the AO will inform the operator as to:

• whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of
Historic Places;

• the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake
before the site can be used.

• a time frame for the AO to complete an expedited review under 36
CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation
Officer, that the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation
is appropriate.

If the operator wished, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the
expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with this process, the
AO will assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization
of the exposed materials that may be required. Otherwise, the operator
will be responsible for mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical
and procedural guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification
from the AO that required mitigation has been completed, the operator will
then be allowed to resume construction.

B. As operator, EOG Resources, Inc. will control noxious weeds
along Right-of-Ways for roads, pipelines, well sites, or other applicable
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facilities. A list of noxious weeds will be obtained from the BLM, or the
appropriate County Extension Office. On BLM administered land, a
Pesticide Use proposal shall be submitted, and given approval, prior to the
application of herbicides or other pesticides or possible hazardous
chemicals.

C. Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this well
site will not be stacked or stored on BLM lands after the conclusion of
drilling operations or at any other time without BLM authorization.
However, if BLM authorization is obtained, it is only a temporary measure
to allow time to make arrangements for permanent storage on commercial
facilities. (The BLM does not seek to compete with private industry.
There are commercial facilities available for stacking and storing drilling
rigs.)

Additional Surface Stipulations
X No construction or drilling activities shall be conducted between May 15 and

June 20 due to Antelope Stipulations.

LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION

PERMITTING AGENT DRILLING OPERATIONS
Ed Trotter Donald Presenkowski
P.O. Box 1910 EOG Resources, Inc.
Vernal, UT 84078 P.O. Box 250
Telephone: (435)789-4120 Big Piney, WY 83113
Fax: (435)789-1420 Telephone: (307)276-4865

All lease or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approval
plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees. EOG Resources, Inc. is fully
responsible for the actions of their subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be
furnished to the field representative to insure compliance.

A copy of the approved APD and ROW grant, if applicable, shall be on location during
construction of the location and drilling activities.

East Chapita I 1-4 D



Certification

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drillsite and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions that presently
exist; that the statements made in the Plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by EOG Resources, Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this Plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved.

Please be advised that EOG Resources, Inc. is considered to be the operator of the East
Chapita 11-4 Well, located in the NW/SE of Section 4, T9S, R23E, Uintah County,
Utah; Lease #U-01304; and is responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease
for the operations conducted upon the leased lands. Bond Coverage is provided under
Bond #NM 2308.

Date Agent/

East Chapita ! 1-4 D



EOG RESOURCES, INC.
EAST CHAPITA #11-4

SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL, UTAH ALONG U.S.
HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 14.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATE
HIGHWAY 88; EXIT LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 17.0 MILES TO OURAY, UTAH; PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3 MILES ON THE SEEP RIDGE
ROAD TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 12.3 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY l.7 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF
THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND
PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY l.9 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST;
TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATLEY 0.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 4.5 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHEAST;
TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATLEY 3.1 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHWEST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A
NORHTWESTERLY, THEN NORTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY
l.3MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO
THE NORTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A NORTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.9 MILES TO THE BEGINNING OF THE PROPOSED
ACCESS ROAD FOR THE CWU #12-5 TO THE SOUTHWEST; FOLLOW ROAD
FLAGS IN A SOUTHWESTERLY, THEN WESTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.4 MILES TO THE BEGINNING OF THE ACCESS ROAD TO
THE NORTHWEST; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN A NORTHWESTERLY
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 20' MILES TO THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION lS APPROXIMATELY 58.1



O O
EOG RESOURCES, INC.

EAST CHAPITA #11-4
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

(LOCATIÓN STAKE

coRNER #5

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHWESTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHWESTERLY

-y, Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying i-OCATIONPHOTos |0606 05 PHOTO
85 South 200 East Vemal, Utah 84078 IMONTH DAY VEAR

-since 1964 _ 435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com TAKENBY:T.B. | DRAWNBV:S.L



' EOG RESOURCES, INC- FICURE //1
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR
EAST CHAPITA #11-4

SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. o

')
1815° FSL 1969' FEL b -As
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65'
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, UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
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EOG RESOURCES, INC· FICURE #2
TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR

×-section EAST CHAPITA #11-4
secle SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

1" =
so, 1815' FSL 1969' FEL

DATE: 06--02-05
Drawn By· P.M.

65 135'

Finished Grade

----
~ ·¯¯ CUT ~

---

'~ Preconstruction
-- Grade

126 135
Slope= 1 //2: /

LOCA T/ON STAKE /

CUT

SM. 1+50

15-- 75 36 135'

T

SM. 0+/8

126
135°

SM. 0+00

NOTE:
.

* NO TETopsoil should not be
- - F/LL QUANT/TY /NCLUOESStripped Below Finished 5X FOR COMPACT/0N

Grade on Substructure Area.

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = J.260 Cu. Yds.

Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 3,260 Cu. Yds.
CUT (1/2 Pit vol.)
(6") Topsoil Stripping = /,600 Cu. Yds.

EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.
Remaininc Location = 5,580 Cu. Yds. (After Rehabilitation)

TOTAL CUT = 7,180 CU.YDS.
FILL = J,920 CU.YOS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVE'YINC

66 So. 200 Kast • Verreal, UgaA 84078 • (435)
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LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
PROPOSED LOCATION N EAST CHAPITA #11-4

SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
1815' FSL 1969' FEL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPO 'GR A PH I c 06 0 05
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PROPOSID LOCATION:
E ST C APITA #

PROPOSED ACCESS FOR
THE #1245 0.4 MI. +/•

RAY 25.8 MI. +l

LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
EXISTING ROAD N EAST CHAPITA #11-4

----------- PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
----------- PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD

SERVICING OTHER WELLs 1815' FSL 1969' FEL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 06 06 05 e
85 Nouth 200 ECast Versassi. Utsah N4O78 M A P mosin osv vtan

(435) 789-8087 * E•½X (435) 789-5883
SCALE: 1"= 2000' DRAWNBY:S.L. REVISED:



PRO O ED LO I N
EAST CHA PITA #11-4 /

E
LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
f DISPOSAL WELLS WATER WELLS N EAST CHA PITA #11-4
e PRODUGNGWELLS ABANDONED WELLS SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

SHUT IN WELLS -#- TEMPORARILY ABANDONED 1815' FSL 1969' FEL
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PROPOSED LOCATION:
EAST CHAPITA #11-4 .·

· O

. 23

Af PROXIMATE TOTAL PIPELINE DISTANCE = 18'+/-
LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.

------- s :
P, ROAD N EAST CHAPITA #11-4

----------- PROPOSED PIPELINE SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
PROPOSED



WORKSHEET
JIwPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL '

APD RECEIVED: 07/06/2005 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-36825

WELL NAME: E CHAPITA 11-4

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC ( N9550 )

CONTACT: ED TROTTER PHONE NUMBER: 435-789-4120

PROPOSED LOCATION:

MWSE 04 090S 230E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SURFACE: 1815 FSL 1969 FEL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 1815 FSL 1969 FEL

UINTAH Engineering

NATURAL BUTTES ( 630 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: U-01304

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal
LATITUDE: 40.06273

PROPOSED FORMATION: PRRV

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.3289

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3.

Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] Unit
(No. NM-2308 )

Potash (Y/N) y R649-3-2. General

A Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From otriotr & 920 setween wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No.49-1501 )

Drilling UnitNÍ RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:

(Date: ) Eff Date:

Jil2L Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:
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OPERATOR: EOC RESOURCES INC (N9550)

SEC:4 T.95 L23E

FIELD:NATURAL BUTTES (630

COUN'IY: UINTAH

SPACING: R669·3-2I GENERAL SITING

.v.li. v.w, n., ,,,
Bah OilGas and Mining

GASINJECHON EXFLORATORY ASANDONED
. cassronace casstomacs acnva
× LOCATION ABANDONED

NEW LOCATION
NF PP OlL COMB1NED

o PLUGGED & ABANDONED NF SECONDARY INAcr!VE

* FRODUCING GAS PENDING PROFO5ED

O FRODUCING OIL FI 01L IFFORAGE
o SHUT-IN CAS PF GAS TERMINA TED
• SHUT•!N OIL -

PP GEOTHERML 6,

M HMP. ABANDONED -

HST WELL FP OIL

• WATER IN)ECHON SECONDARY

• WATER SUFPLY TERMINATED FREPARED BY:DIANA WHITNEY

« WATER DISFOSAL DATE:



JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah July 11, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
FJ¢cutive Direcia, EOG Resources, Inc.

PO Box 1815
Division of Vernal, UT 84078

Oil, Gas & Mining

JOHN R. BAZA
oivisionoirec'"' Re: East Chapita11-4 Well, 1815' FSL, 1969' FEL, NW SE, Sec.4, T. 9 South,

R. 23 East, I)intah Çounty,Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah CodeAnn.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36825.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Acting Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah CountyAssessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West Nonh Tetnple,Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt take City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340• facsimile(801)359-3940•TTY (801)538-7458• www



Operator: EQQResources, Inc.
Well Name & Number East Çhapita11-4

API Number: 43-047-36825
Lease: U-01304

Location: NW SE Sec._4_ T. 9 South R. 23 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALINESOURGES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 6. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

U-01304
8. IF INDIAN.ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnewwells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such poposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER;
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER EAST CHAPITA 11-04

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR; 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-36825
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX 1815 ciTY VERNAL STATE UT ,,,84078 (435) 781-9111 NATURAL BUTTES

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1815 FSL 1969 FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN; NWSE 4 9S 23E S.LB.&M STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDI2E DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBlNG REPAIR

CHANGE TUBlNG PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: MOVE LOCATION
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent detalls including dates, depths, volumes, etc

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests permission to move the referenced well,

From: 1815 FSL 1969 FEL, NWSE, Section 4, T9S, R23E, Uintah County, UT

To: 1926 FSL 2179 FEL, NWSE, Section 4, T9S, R23E, Uintah County, UT

Lo40/ST Approved by ,

L/ Jg go Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mmmg

NAME (PLEASEPRINT) Kaylene R. Gardner

SIG

TITLEE Regtdatory Assistant

(This space for State use only)

RECElVED
JULi 2



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASANDMINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER
U-01304

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ONWELLS 6 IF INDIAN.ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAME

7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME
Do not use this form for proposals to dnil newwells, significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth. reenterplugged wells, or to

dnli honzantal laterais Use APPLICATION FOR PERMif TO DRILLform for such proposals
i TYPE OF WELL 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER

OIL WELL O GASWELL OTHER EAST CHAPITA 11-04
2 NAMEOF OPERATOP 9 API NUMBER

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-36825
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONENUMBER 10 FIELD AND POOL. OR WILDCAT

P.O. BOX 1815 VERNAL
.,

UT ,84078 (435) 781-9111 NATURAL BUTTES

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE 1815 FSL 1969 FEL coUNTY UINTAH

QTROTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE. MERIDIAN NWSE 4 9S 23E S.L.B.&M STATE
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION .

.
TYPE OF ACTION .

O ACIDIZE O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duple:ate) ALTER CASING O FRACTURE TREAT O SIDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASING REPAIR O NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGE TOPREVIOUS PLANS O OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUGAND ABANDON O VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME O scuo ases O WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Onginal Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS O PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) O WATER SHUT-OFF
Dale ofwork completion

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIOM RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER MOVE LOCATIÇN
O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshowall pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests permission to move the referenced well,

From: 1815 FSL 1969 FEL, NWSE, Section 4, T9S, R23E, Uintah County, UT

To: 1926 FSL 2179 FEL, NWSE, Section 4. T9S, R23E, UIntah County, UT

Approved by the ]Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 1- '

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Kayle R. Gardner titte Regulatory Assistant

SIGNAT A DATE 7/10/2006

(This space for stateuse caly)

JUL : 2 2006
)) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) 0



STAÝEOF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASAND MINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER
U-01304

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ONWELLS O IF INDIAN.ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME
Do not use this fomi for proposals todrtlinewwells, significantlydeepen existmgwells below currentbottorn-hole depih. reenter plugged wells. or to

dnil hortzontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TODRILLform for suchproposals
1 TYPE OF WELL - 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBEROIL WELL GAS WELL M OTHER EAST CHAPITA 11-04
2 NAMEOF OPERATOR 9 API NUMBER

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-36825
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER 10 FIELD AND POOL OR WILDCAT
P.O. BOX 1815 VERNAL , UT .,,,84078 (435) 781-9111 NATURALBUTTES

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE 1815 FSL 1969 FEL coUNTY UINTAH

QTRIQTR. SECTION. TOWNSHIP. RANGE. MERIDIAN NWSE 4 9S 23E S.L.B.&M STATE
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXESTO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION .

. TYPE OF ACTION .

NOTICEOF INTENT
ACIDIZE O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submitin Duph<ate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT O SIDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL

Approximate cielework willstart CASING REPAIR O NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TOPREVIOUS PLANS O OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUGANDABANDON O VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK O WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Onginal Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS O PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) O WATER SMUT-OFF
Dale ofwork completion

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER MOVE LOCATION
O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONSCleertyshowallpeitinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests permission to move the referenced well,

From: 1815 FSL 1969 FEL, NWSE, Section 4. T9S, R23E, UIntah County, UT

To: 1926 FSL 2179 FEL, NWSE, Section 4, T9S, R23E, UIntah County, UT

M ardner EE ROgUlstOry Assistant

(This space for State use only)

V2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



EOG RESOURCES, INC.
EAST CI lAPITA #l l-4

I.OCATED IN UINTAH COt'NTY, UTAII
SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.I..B.& 51.
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EOG RESOURCES,INC.
EAST CHAPITA #11-4

SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL, UTAH ALONG U.S.
HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 14.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATE
HIGHWAY 88; EXIT LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 17.0 MILES TO OURAY, UTAH; PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY0.3 MILES ON THE SEEP RIDGE
ROAD TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 12.3 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLYDIRECTIONAPPROXIMATELYl.7 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF
THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND
PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.9 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST;
TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATLEY 0.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTINGROADTO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY,
THEN SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 4.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A
NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATLEY 3.1 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHWEST;
TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 1.3 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
NORTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.9 MILES TO THE BEGINNING
OF THE PROPOSED ACCESSROAD FOR THE #12-5 TO THE WEST; FOLLOW
ROAD FLAGS IN A WESTERLY, THEN SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY0.4 MILES TO THE BEGINNINGOF THE PROPOSEDACCESS
ROAD TO THE NORTHWEST; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN A NORTHWESTERLY
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 260' TO THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 57.9



EOG RESOURCES, NC.T9S R23E S.L B.&M.
Well location, EAST CHAPITA #11-4, locoted as
shown in the NW 1/4 SE 1/4 of Section 4,TBS SB9°55°E

- 5280.00 (G.L.O.) T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. Uintoh County, Utoh.
T9S BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK 58 EAM (1965) LOCATEDIN THE NE 1/4 OF
SECTION 30. T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE REDLOT 4 LOT 3 LOT 2 LOT 1 WASH SE. QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5
MINUTEQUAD. (TOPOGRAPHICMAP) PUBLISHED BY THE
UNITEDSTATES DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR. GEOLOGICAL
SURVEY. SAID ELEVATION IS MARKEDAS BEING 5132 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGSIS A C.P.S. OBSERVATION.

o
oO
O(n
y)1977 AWms C

af

EAST CHAP/TA /11-4
2 79

Elev. Ungraded Ground = 4972'

SCALE

CERTIFI LAluß
THIS IS TO CERTWY THAT THE T WAS OM
FRD NOTES OF ACTUAL BY ME OR
SUPERVISION AND THATTHE THE
BEST OF MY KNOM.EDGEAND

1977 si Ca 1977 &ass Cg 1977 &ass C , * •

of Stmes Pimet Aart
SB9°47°52"W

- 2632.87' (Meas.) SB9°58'13"W
- 2643.94 (Meas.) REVISED: 07-16-05 -

Unrra ENGINEERING a LANo SURVEYMG
85 SOUTH 200 KAST - VERNAI. UTAN 84078

(435) 789-1017(NAD 83)LEGEND-
-

SCALE DATE SURVEYED DATE DRAMk
•

LATITUDE - 40°03'46.87" (40.063019) 1" = 1000 05-25-05 06-02-05L LONGITUDE=
109°19°49.40"

(109.330389)=
90° SYMBOL

PARTY REFERENCES(NAD 27)
T.B. B.C. P.M. G.LO. PLAT= PROPOSED WELLHEAD. LATlTUDE = 40'03°46.99"

(40.063053)
«AINER FitELONGITUDE-

109°19°48.95" (109.329708)A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. COOL EOG RESOURCES.



EOG RESOURCES, INC· FIGURE #1
LOCATIONLAYOUTFOR
EAST CHAPITA#11-4

Approx.
SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. To. of

og 1926' FSL 2179' FEL Fill Slope
F- J.2' E-14.6'
E/. 70 2' ¿Proaposed Access

E/ 58 8'

SCALE: 1" -
50°

.
. ...,.

:-,
.

. J.A 5
DATE: 06-02-05 65'

Drown By P.M.
Revised: 07-16-05 s

- -2, | Round Corners
.

Ei. 77.J' as needed

NOTE:
Eorthwork Calculations Require
o Fill of 1.0 O the Locotion •

Stoke For Bolonce. All FIII is Ô
to be Compocted to o Minimum Ë N
of 95% of the Moximum Dry :
Density Obtoined by AASHTO E •

Method t-99. . •

NO7E: . • ··

Flore Pit is to be located
a min. of 100' from the I l I I I Of
im// Head.

PIPE RACKS

Pit Topsos I I I I I

E-0. J· F-1.Û
nr g, ya ,• E/. 72 4

20' WOf SE#C S DOG NOUSE

....

' 8

Drainage El 6J.8'

PUMP

MUDSHED TOILET

.... HOPPER

POWER

---

Toot.s

- -- W ---- FUEL
--- ------ sTonAGE
---. Sta 0+18 - W SH C-5.6' TANK •

(etm pi Approx.
Top of

NO1ES: cut siop.
E/ev. U gr Ground At Loc. Stake - 4972.4'

, UINTAH ENGINE£RING & LAND SURVEYINGTIN/SHED GRADEELEV A T LOC STAKE - 497J.4 ,, s, ,,, ,,,, • v.m.s. m.a esora • ress;



EOG RESOURCES, INC- FIGURE #2
o TYPICALCROSS SECTIONS FOR
" ×-section EAST CHAPITA #11-4 ..·

. 't* scole SECTION 4, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
. Á

1926' FSL 2179' FEL = su . ·
.

· :Y - so :ec·. WOBER :·¯-

-
. K 5DATE: 06-02-05 '..

Drown By P.M. •

Rev:sec: 07-16-05
65' 135° ti

Preconstruction
finished GrodeGrade

F/LL ( . C//T .

126 135

Slope= 1 1/2: I
LOCW770N STAKE (TP )

I CUT

S M. 1+50

.. 75 36 135

S M. 0 18
ur

S M. 0+00
* HOTE:

F/LL QUAN717Y/NCLUDES
5% FOR COWPAC7/OV

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES ExcESS MATERIAL = J,J80 Cu. Yds.
Topsoil & Pit Bockfill = J, J60 Cu. Yds.CUT (1/2 Pit vol.)(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,720 Cu. Yds.
EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.Remoining Location = 8,450 Cu. Yds.
(After Rehobilitation)

TOTAL CUT = 10,170 CU.YDS.
FILL = 6,790 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

05 So. Æ00 Ætssi * Vermel, UteA 84078 • (486)
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PROPOSED LOCATION:
EAS
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0.9 MI. +/-

1.EGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASANDMINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER
U-01304

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IF INDIAN.ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME
Do not use this form foi p<oposals to anilnew wells. signrficantlydeepen existingwells below Current bottom-hole dopin. reenterplugged wells. or to

dnil honzontal laterais Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals

1 TYPE OF WELL - - 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER
OILWELL LJ GASWELL M OTHER EAST CHAPITA 11-04

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR 9 API NUMBER

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-36825
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER 10 FIEl.D AND POOL. OR WILDCAT

P O. BOX 1815 VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-9111 NATURAL BUTTES

4 LOCATIONOFWEL.

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE 1815 FSL 1969 FEL coUNTY UINTAH

OTRK)TR SECTION TOWNSHIP RANGE. MERIDIAN NWSE 4 9S 23E S.L.B.&M STATE
UTAH

il CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN O REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
2 NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submrtin Dupitcate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximato date work willstan CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CMANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS O OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CMANGETUBING PLUGAND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUEN¯ REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Ongiral Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SMUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER APD EXTENSION
O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION REQUEST

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths. volumes, etc

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests the APD for the referenced well be extended for one year.

Approvedby the
'

Utah Division of

Oil, Gas ane Mn og

Date: ~

NAME(PLEASEPRIN1) yl ne R. Gardner

sigA

TITLEE Oulat06ryAssistant

(This space for State us9only)
NECEI VED
JUL i 220%

(5/2000) (SeeinstructionsonReverseSide)
UNOF0ll-,GAS&



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform shouldaccompanythe Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-36825
Well Name: EAST CHAPITA 11-04

Location: 1815 FSL 1969 FEL (NWSE), SECTION 4, T9S, R23E S.L.B.& M
Company Permit Issued to: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
Date Original Permit Issued: 7/11/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklistof some items related to the application,which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownershipchanged, ifso, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes O NoO

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location7 YesO Nom

Has there been any unitor other agreements put in place thatcould affect the
permitting or operation of thisproposed welI7 YesO Nom

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way,which could affect the proposed location? YesO No O

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged7 YesO NoO

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
whichwill require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation7YesO NoO

Is bonding stillin place, which covers thisproposed well? Yes2NoO

7/10/2006

Date

Title: REGULATORY ASSISTANT

Representing: EOG RESOURCES, INC.

RECEiVED
JUL122OW

DIVOF0lLGAS&



Qµ>6 /7)
RECEIVE

Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) AWU4 2M OMB No. 1004-0137

Expires March 31,2007

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERgg0F OIL,GAS&MIN case serialNo.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT U-01304
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER

la. Typc of Work: DRILL O REENTE .. § lOÛ$
7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

8. Lease Name and Well No.

Ib. Type of Well Oil Well Gas Well Ü Other O sinstezoneU Multiple Zone EAST CHAPITA 11-4

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

EOG RESOURCES, INC.

3a. Address P.O. BOX 1815 3b. Phone No. (Inchedearea code) 10. Ficid and Pool, or Exploratory

VERNAL, UT 84078 | (435)789-0790 NATURAL BUTTES
4. l.ocation of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or BIk. and Survey or Area

At surface 1815' FSL, 1969' FEL NW/SE SEC. 4, T9S, R23E,
At proposed plod. Zone S.L.B.& M.

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post officc* 12. County or Parish 13. State

27.1 MILES SOUTHEAST OF OURAY, UTAH UINTAH | UTAH
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of Acres in Icase 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well

location to nearcst 1815' 40
property or Icase line, 11. 245)

(Also to nearest drig. Unit line, if any)

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLMIBIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, drilling, completed' s NM-2308
applied for, on this lease, ft. SeeTopo Map c 9400

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT,GL, etc.) 22.Approximate date work will start* 23. Esti mated duration

4971.5 FEET GRADED GROUND UPON APPROVAL | 45 DAYS
24. Attachments

Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an cxisting bond on file
2. A Drillirg Plan. (sce Item 20 above).
3. A Surface Usc Plan (if the location is on National Forcst System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall bc filed with the appropriate Forest Service Ollicc). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required
by the authorized officer

i I

25 Signature Name(Printec&Tiped) Date

/A / Ed Trotter Acce9 d June 27, 2005

Agent Og Gas

Approved by (Signature) Name (Printed/Tiped) Date

Titic Of11cc
l\Ainral ROSOlitces

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds Icgal or equitabic titic to those rights in the subject Icase which would entitic the applicant to
conduct operations thercon.
Conditions of Approval, if any, are attached.

Titic 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

*(Instructionsonpage 2) we e ¡ONSOFAPFROVALATTAE
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Well: East Chapita 11-4

2/2/2006
WOA

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
11 BUREAUOF LANDMANAGEMENT

· VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: EOG Resources, Inc. Location: NWSE, Sec. 4, T9S, R23E
Well No: East Chapita 11-4 Lease No: UTU-01304
API No: 43-047-36825 Agreement: N/A

Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker Office:435-781-4490 Cell: 435-828-4470
Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee Office:435-781-4432 Cell: 435-828-7875
Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger Office:435-781-4502 Cell: 435-828-3913
Environmental Scientist: Paul Buhler Office:435-781-4475 Cell: 435-828-4029
Environmental Scientist: Karl Wright Office:435-781-4484
Natural Resource Specialist: Holly Villa Office:435-781-4404
Natural Resource Specialist: Melissa Hawk Office:435-781-4476
After hours contact number: (435) 781-4513 FAX: (435) 781-4410

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONSSHALLBE FURNISHEDTO YOUR
FIELDREPRESENTATIVETO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operationsare to be conducted in such a manner that fullcompliance is
made with the applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application
for Permit to Drillincluding Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is
considered fullyresponsible for the actionsof his subcontractors. A copyof the approvedAPD
must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion operations.

NOTIFICATIONREQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight(48) hours prior to construction of location and
(Notify Paul Buhler) access roads.

Location Completion - Prior to moving on the drilling rig.
(Notify Paul Buhler)

Spud Notice - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.
(Notify PE)

Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and
(Notify Jamie Sparger SPT) cementing all casing strings.

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
(Notify Jamie Sparger SPT)

First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify PE) production resumes after well has been off production for

more than ninety (90)



- Page 2 of 6
Well: East Chapita 11-4

2/2/2006

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL(COAs)

• Within 90 calendardays of the approval date for thisApplication for Permit to Drill (APD),
the operator/lessee shall submit to the Authorized Officer (AO),on Sundry Notice Form
3160-5, an Interim Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on well pads,
access roads, and pipelines. At a minimum,thiswould include the reshaping of the pad
to the originalcontour to the extent possible; the respreading of the top soil up to the rig
anchor points; and, the area reseeded using appropriatereclamation methods.The AO
willprovide written approval or concurrence within30 calendar days of receipt. During
interim management of the surface, use the following seed mix:

o 9 lbs of Hycrest Crested Wheatgrass & 3 Ibs of Kochia prostrate.

• As a Best Management Practice (BMP), the pipeline would be buried withinthe identified
construction widthof an access corridor that contains the access road and pipelines.
Exceptions to this BMPmay be granted where laterally extensive, hard indurated
bedrock, such as sandstone, is at or within 2 feet of the surface; and, soil types with a
poor history of successful rehabilitation).

• Prior to abandonment ofa buried pipeline, the operatorwould obtain authorizationfrom
the appropriateregulatory agency. BLMwilldetermine whether the pipeline and all
above ground pipeline facilities shall be removed and unsalvageable materialsdisposed
of at approvedsites or abandoned in place. Reshaping and revegetation of disturbed
land areas willbe completed where necessary.

• Ifpaleontological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator is to
immediately stop work, and contactthe Authorized Officer (AO).A report willbe
prepared by the Paleontologist and submitted to the BLMat the completion of surface
disturbing activities.

• A right-ofway would be required for the pipeline which travelsoff lease, approximately
2,640
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Well: East Chapita 11-4

2/2/2006

DOWNHOLE CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL

AII provisions outlined in Onshore OIIand Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be
strictly adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLECONDITIONSOF APPROVAL
1. None

DRILLINGlCOMPLETIONIPRODUCINGOPERATINGSTANDARDS
1. There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion,and/or workover

program as approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. AIIwells,
whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well. Any changes in
operationmust have priorapproval from the BLM, Vernal Field Office Petroleum
Engineers.

2. The spud date and timeshall be reported orally to Vernal Field Officewithin24 hours of
spudding.

3. Notify Vernal Fleid Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineerinq Technician at least
24 hours in advance of casing cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure

4. Blowoutprevention equipment (BOPE) willremain in use untilthe well is completedor
abandoned. Closing unit controls must remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all
times. Choke manifolds must be located outside of the rig substructure.

AIIBOPE components willbe inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in
the daily drillingreport. Components shallbe operated and tested as required by
Onshore Oiland Gas Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE
pressure tests must be performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and i by the
rig pumps. Test must be reported in the driller's log.

BOP drills must be initially conducted by each drilling crew within24 hours of drilling out
from under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specifiedin Onshore Oiland
Gas Order No. 2.

Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set
and cemented in place.

No aggressivelfresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used withincasing.

5. All shows of fresh water and minerals willbe reported and protected. A sample will be
taken of any water flows and a water analysis furnished the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All
oil and gas shows will be adequately tested for commercial possibilities, reported, and
protected.

6. No location willbe constructed or moved, no wellwillbe plugged, and no drilling or
workover equipment willbe removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status
without prior approval of the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Ifoperations are to be
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2/2/2006
for more than 30 days, prior approval ofthe BLM, Vernal Field Officemust be obtained
and notificationgiven before resumption of operations.

7. Chronologic drilling progress reports must be filed directly withthe BLM, Vernal Field
Officeon a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers
untilthe well is completed.

Any change in the program must be approved by the BLM, Vernal Field Office. "Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be filed for allchanges of plans
and other operations in accordancewith43 CFR ' 3162.3-2.

Emergency approval may be obtained orally,but such approval does not waive the
written report requirement. Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of
facilities, including roads, gathering lines, batteries, etc., which willresult in the
disturbance of new ground, willrequire the filingof a suitable plan pursuant to Onshore
Oiland Gas Order No. 1 of 43 CFR 3164.1 and priorapproval by the BLM, Vernal Field
Office.

In accordancewith 43 CFR ' 3162.4-3, thiswellmust be reported on the "Monthly Report
of Operations" (Oiland Gas Operations Report ((OGOR))starting withthe monthin
which operations commence and continue each month untilthe well is physically
plugged and abandoned. This report shouldbe filed in duplicate, directly with the
Minerals Management Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call
1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-3650 for reporting information.

8. Whether the well is completedas a dry hole or as a producer, "WellCompletion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30
days after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all
other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or
completion operations,willbe filed on BLMForm 3160-4. Submit with the well
completion report a geologic report including,at a minimum,formation tops, and a
summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys, sample descriptions, strip
logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if performed.
Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) willbe submitted only when requested by the BLM,
Worland Field Office.

Please submit an electronic copy of all logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welliogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM. The cement bond log must be submitted in
raster format (TIF, PDF other).

9. AIIoff-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or comminglingon-lease or off-lease will
have prior written approval from the BLM, Vernal Field Office.

All measurement points shall be identified as point of sales or allocation for royalty
determination prior to the installation of facilities.

10. Oiland gas meters willbe calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The Field Office
Petroleum Engineers willbe provided witha date and timefor the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be
submitted to the BLM,Vernal Field Office. AIImeasurement facilities willconform to
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AP1 standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas
measurement.

11. A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oiland Gas Order No. 3 shall be
submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Officewithin30 days of installation or first production,
whichever occurs first. All site security regulations as specifiedin Onshore Oiland Gas
Order No. 3 shall be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon
storage tanks willbe effectivelysealed in accordance with Onshore Oil and Gas Order
No. 3.

12. This APD is approved subject to the requirement that, shouldthe well be successfully
completed for production, the BLM, Vernal Field officemust be notifiedwhen it is placed
in a producing status. Such notificationwill be by written communication and must be
received in this office by not later than the fifthbusiness day followingthe date on which
the well is placed on production. The notificationshallprovide, as a minimum,the
following informational items:

a. Operator name, address, and telephonenumber.
b. Well name and number.
c. Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).
d. Date well was placed in a producing status (date offirst production

for which royaltywillbe paid).
e. The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil,or crude oil and

casing head gas, or natural gas and entrained liquid
hydrocarbons).

f. The Federal or Indian lease prefixand number on which the well
is located; otherwise the non-Federal or non-Indian land category,
i.e., State or private.

g. Unitagreement and / or participatingarea name and number,if
applicable.

h. Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

13. Any venting or flaring ofgas willbe done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A
and needs prior approvalfrom Field OfficePetroleum Engineers.

14. AIIundesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL
3A willbe reported to the BLM,Vernal Field Office. Majorevents as defined in NTL3A,
willbe reported verbally within24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days.
"Other than Major Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will
be reported on the Monthly Report of Operations and Production.

15. Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of
water produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production.
A permanent disposal method must be approved by this officeand in operation prior to
the end of this 90-day period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the
proposed permanent disposal method should be submitted along with any necessary
water analyses, as soon as possible, but no later than 45 days afterthe date of first
production. Any method of disposal which has not been approved prior to the end of the
authorized 90-day period will be considered as an Incident of Noncompliance and willbe
grounds for issuing a shut-in order untilan acceptable manner for disposing of said
water is provided and approved by this



Page 6 of 6
Well: East Chapita 11-4

2/2/2006
16. Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oralapproval, the Field

Office Petroleum Engineers must be notifiedat least 24 hours in advance of the plugging
of the well, in orderthat a representative maywitness plugging operations. Ifa well is
suspended or abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled.
The "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within
30 days after the actual plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of
cement in each, and amount of casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface



STATE OF UTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GASANDMINING 5 lEASEDESIGNATIONANDGERIALNUMBER:
U-01304

SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTS ONWELLS 6 IFINDIAN ALLOTTEEORTRIBËNAME

7. JNIT orCA AGREEMENTNAMEDo notase Unefenn for proposals in ont new weis, sigmicennyasepenelesangwells below currentbottom·ftoledepst reenter plugged wens orto
dril honzarlial Islerala Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTOORILL(anninr suchprop058ls

a MELLNAMEandNUMBER1 TYPEOF WEL
OILWELL 0 GAS WELL OTHER EASTCHAPITA11-04

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR 9 APINUMBER
EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-36825

3 ADDRESSOF O ERATOR PHONENUMBËÅ 10 FIELDANDPOOL OR WILDCAT
P o. BOX1615 ., VERNAL

y, UT ,,,84078 (435) 781-9111 NATURALBUTTES
4 LOCATIONOF MELL

FOOTAGESA1 BURFAce 1926 FSL 2179 FEL 40.062714 LAT 109.329636 LON COUNTY UINTAH

OmlOTRSECTION TOWNSNIP.RANGE.MER©lAN NWSE 4 9S 23E S.L.B.&M 6TAfti.

UTAH

, CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOXESTO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O ^cm 0 CEEPEN O REPERFORATECURRENTFORMATONO NOTICEOF INTENT
(St.timitle Duplicat•• O ATER CM FRACTUREREAT O $©ETRACK TOREPAR WER

Approanste date workwil aloit CASINGM- O NEWCONBmuCTI 'EMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVOUSPUNS O OPERATOACM TUS AGREPAIR

0 CMANGET- O RUG ANDABANDON - OR FØRE

O SUBSEQUENTREPORT O CM WFLL.NAME O wooo.ac× O -== =•eosa
(S.ginnt Onginsi Form Only)

O CHANGEWER STATU6 PRODUCT N (STARTRESUME) O WATERSHUT4FFDele ofwork corr¢etort
O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFOMONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHE APD EXTENSION
O CONVERTWE TYPE O RECOMAETE -O FERENT WORMATION REQUEST

12. DESCRI6E PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dem depths, volumes, etc

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests the APD for the referenced well be extended for one year.

~ Approved by the
U

On L

Date:
By:

NAME(PLEASEPRINT, e R. Gardner Im., Regulatory Assistant

si , ,.« sa. / OATE .0/26/2006

ghis spese for State use )

20m) (6eemounumm Remse S., RECElVED
AUS2 2 2M

blvUEUIL,DAS&



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(tNs form shouldaccompanythe Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-e47-36eas
Well Name: EAST CHAPITA 11-04
Location: 1926 FSL 2179 FEL (NWSE), SECTION 4, T9S, R23E S.L.B.&M
Company Permit Issued to: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
Date Original Permit issued: 7/11/2005

The undersigned as ownerwith legal rights todrillon the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submittedin the previously
approvedapplicationto drill,remains validand does not require revision.

Followinais a checklistofsome items related totheaoulication,which shouldbe
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownershipchanged, ifso, has thesurfaœ
agreementbeen updated? YesONoO

Have any wells been drilled in thevicinityof the proposed wellwhlch wouldaffect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location7 YesO Nom

Has there been any unitor other agreements put in place that couldaffect the
permitting or operation of thisproposed well?YesONol2I

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way,which couldaffecttheproposed location? YesO NoO

Has the approvedsource of waterfor drillingchanged? YesO NoU

Have there been any physical changes to thesurface location or access route
whichwillrequire à change in plans fromwhat was discussed at theonsite
evaluation? Yes O NoO

Is bon ing still in place, which covers thisproposed well? YesŒNoO

e26/2006
n ture Date

Title: REGULATORY ASSISTANT

Representing: EOG RESOURCES,INC.

RECEIVED
AUS22 2M

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: EOG RESOURCES INC

Well Name: E CHAPITA 11-4

Api No: 43-047-36825 Lease Type: FEDERAL

Section 04 Township 09S Range 23E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor ROCKY MOUNTAIN DRLG RIG # RATHOLE

SPUDDED:
Date 01/17/07

Time 5:30 PM

How DRY

Drilling wi/I Commence:

Reported by JERRY

Telephone # (435) 828-1720

Date 01/18/2007 Signed



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: EOG RESOURCES, INC· Operator Account Number: N 9550

Address: 600 17th Street

city Denver

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (303) 262-2812

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-36825 EAST CHAPITA 11-4 NWSE 4 9S 23E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A 99999 1/17/2007 /
Comments: ..

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

Well 3

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Carrie MacDonald

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) Na (Please Print)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existingentity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entRyRE """
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) CEIVEgperationsClerk 1/22/2007

Title . DateJAN2 3 2007
(5/2000)

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



F(xm 3160-5 UNITEDSTATES FORMAPPROVED
(Febmary2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR E0 1,

007
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-01304

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse sidO. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of 11
OilWell GasWell Other 8. Well Nameand No.

2 NameofOperator East chapita11-4
EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 43-047-36825

600 17th Street, Suite 1000N, Denver, CO 80202 303-262-2812 10.FieldandPool,or ExploratoryArea

4 Locationof Well (Footage,Sec, T, R.,M, or SurveyDescnption) Natural Buttes/Wasatch/Mesaverde

1,926' FSL & 2,179' FEL (NWSE) I1. Countyor Parish, State

Sec. 4-T9S-R23E 40.063019 LAT 109.330389 LON Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off
Noticeof Intent Alter Casing FractureTreat Reclamation Well Integrity

SubsequentReport Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Well spud

ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporarilyAbandon
FinalAbandonment Notice Convertto Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or CompletedOperation(clearly stateall pertinentdetails,including estimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If theproposal istodeependirectionally or recomplete horizontally,givesubsurface locationsand measured and truevertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach theBondunder which thework will beperformedor providetheBond No. on filewith BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequent reports must befiledwithin 30days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. If theoperationresults ina multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 31604 must befiledonce
testinghasbeencompleted. FinalAbandonment Noticesmust befiledonly after all requirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted, and theoperator has
deternined thatthesite is ready for final inspection.)

The referenced well spud on 1/17/2007.

14. I hereby certify thatthe foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Signature

d atee Operations Clerk

01/18/2007

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approval of thisnotice doesnot warrant or
certify thatthe applicant holdslegalor equitabletitleto thoserights inthe subjectlease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18U.S.C. Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crime for any personknowinglyand willfully tomaketo any departmentor agency of the United
States anyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations asto anymatter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page 2) RECEIVED

JAN2 32007

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



Fœn 3160-5 UNITEDSTATES FORMAPPROVED
(February2005) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR E0pM

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS v-oiso4

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse sidG. 7. If Unitor CA/Agreement, Nameand/or No

1. Type o 1
OilWell / GasWell Other 8. Wel1NameandNo.

2. NameofOperator East Chapita 11-4
EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 43-047-36825

600 17th Street, Suite 1000N, Denver, CO 80202 303-262-2812 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4 Location of Well (Footage,Sec, T, R.,M, orSurveyDescnption) Natural Buttes/Wasatch/Mesaverde

1,926' FSL & 2,179' FEL (NWSE)
11. Countyor Parish, State

Sec. 4-T9S-R23E 40.063019 LAT 109.330389 LON Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off
Noticeof Intent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other
ChangePlans Plug and Abandon TemporarilyAbandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convertto Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposedor CompletedOperation(clearly state all pertinentdetails,includingestimatedstarting dateof any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If theproposalistodeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurface locationsand measured and truevertical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.

Attach theBondunder which thework will be performedor providetheBondNo. onfilewith BLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequent reports must befiledwithin 30days
followingcompletionof the involvedoperations. If theoperation results ina multiple completion or recompletion ina newinterval,a Form31604 must befiledonce

testinghasbeencompleted. FinalAbandonmentNoticesmust befiledonly after allrequirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted, and theoperator has
determinedthatthesite isready forfinalinspection.)

EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization for disposal of produced water from the referenced well to any of the following locations.

1. Natural Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD
2. Ace Disposal
3. RN Industries

Accepted by the
'

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY

14. I hereby certify thatthe foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Sipature

atee Operations Clerk

01/18/2007

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby Title Date

Conditionsof approval,if any, are attached. Approvalof thisnotice doesnot warrant or

certifythatthe applicantholdslegalor equitable titleto thoserights in the subject lease Office
whichwould entitle the applicant to conduct operationsthereon.

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001andTitle43 U.S.C.Section1212, makeit a crime for any personknow lly tomaketo any departmentor agencyof the United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulent statementsor representations as to anymatter s i .

(Instructions on page 2)
JAN232007

DN.0F0\L,GAS&



Form 31(&5 UNITED STATES EURMAPPROVED
(Eebruary2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR SpiiŠf¡ co?

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeasesenalNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U *13**

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, AllotteeorTnbe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

l. Type of
ilWell g GasWell Other 8. Wel1Name and Na

2. NarneofOperator
EAST CHAPITA 11-4

EOG Resources. Inc. 9. AP1Well No.

3a Address 3b. Phone No.(include area code) 43-047-36825

600 17th St., Suite 1000N, Denver, CO 80202 303-824-5526 10.Fieldand Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4. Location of Well (F<x>tage.Sec, T.,R., M, or Survev Description) Natural Buttes/Wasatch/Mesaverde

1926' FSL & 2179' FEL (NWISE)
I L Countyor Parish, State

Sec. 4-T9S-R23E 40.063019 LAT 109.330389 LON Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Producdon (Stan/Resume) WaterShut-Off
Notice of Intent AlterCasing Fracture Treat Reclamation Wellntegnty

SubsequentReport Casing Repaa NewConstruction Recomplete Other
ChangePlans Plug and Abandon TempomrilyAbandon

Final AbandonmentNotice ConvernoInjection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearly state all pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof.
If the proposalistodeependiæetionallyor æcomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measumd and tmeveltical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.

Attach the Bond under which the work will beperformedor providetheBondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequent reports must be filed within 30days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. Iftheoperation results ina multiple completion or æcompletion ina new interval,a Form3160-4must be filedonce

testing has beencompleted. Final AbandonmentNoticesmust befiledonly after all æguirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted, and theoperator has
determinedthatthe siteisready forfinalinspection.)

The referenced well was turned to sales on 4/9/20(fl. Please see the attached operations summary report for drilling and completion operations
performed on the subject well.

14. 1hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant04/18/20(V1

THIS SPACE FR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
I i

Approvedby Title Date

Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approval of thisnotice doesnot warrant or
certify that the applicant holdslegalor equitable titleto those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle theapplicanttoconductoperationsthereon.

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212, make it a crime foranyperson knowinglyand willfully to make to any deparnnen
States any false,tictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2) 067

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 04-18-2007

Wel1Name ECW011-04 WellType DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA WELLS DEEP API # 43-047-36825 Well Class ISA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 02-20-2007 Class Date 04-09-2007

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9.400/9,400 Property # 057268

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 4,988/ 4,972

Location Section 4. T9S, R23E, NWSE, 1926 FSL & 2179 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCESINC. WI % 100.0 NRI % 84.75

AFE No 303481 AFE Total DHC / CWC '

Rig Contr ENSIGN Rig Name ENSIGN #72 Start Date 01-05-2007 Release Date 02-28-2007

07-07-2005 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling 50 Completion 50 WeHTotal 50

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONDATA

1815' FSL & 1969' FEL (NW/SE)

SECTION 4, T9S, R23E

UlNTAH COUNTY, UTAH

LAT 40.062747, LONG 109.328956 (NAD 27)

RIG: ENSIGN#72

OBJECTIVE: 9400' TD, WASATCH

DW/GAS

EAST CHAPITA PROSPECT

DD&A: CHAPITA DEEP

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD

LEASE: U-01304

ELEVATION: 4972.7' NAT GL, 4971.5' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING4972' IS THE PREP GL), 4988' KB (16')

EOG WI 100%, NRI 84.75%

12-29-2006 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total a



Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILDLOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

%:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION STARTED.

01-02-2007 Reported By BRYON TOLMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION 40% COMPLETE.

01-03-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION STARTED.

01-04-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 ROCKED OUT DRILLING.

01-05-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHINGOUT PIT.

01-08-2007 Reported By BRYON TOLMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Page



Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0-0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILDLOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHINGOUT PIT

01-09-2007 Reported By BRYON TOLMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total ?

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHINGOUT PIT.

01-10-2007 Reported By BRYON TOLMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0 0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHINGOUT PIT.

01-11-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Tota! $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHING OUT PIT.

01-12-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion $0 Well Total i

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LINING PIT.

01-15-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Page



Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION COMPLETE.

01-19-2007 Reported By KAYLENE GARDNER

Daily Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 40 TVD 40 Progress 0 Days 1 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO AIR RIG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 ROCKY MOUNTAIN DRILLING SPUD AN 20" HOLE ON 1/17/2007 @ 5:30 PM. SET 40' OF 14" CONDUCTOR.

CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX. JERRY BARNES NOTIFIED MICHAEL LEE W/BLM AND CAROL
DANIELSWIUDOGM OF THE SPUD 1/17/2007 @ 4:30 PM.

01-30-2007 Reported By JERRY BARNES

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total 5 *

Cum Costs: Drilling ! Completion $0 Well Total

MD 2,446 TVD 2,446 Progress 0 Days 2 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO AIR RIG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU BILL JR'S AIR RIG #6 ON 1/21/2007. DRILLED 12-1/4" HOLE TO 2460' GL ENCOUNTERED 1620' WATER.

RAN 59 JTS (2430') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#/FT, J-55, ST&C CASING WITH WEATHERFORD GUIDE SHOE AND FLOAT
COLLAR. 8 CENTRALIZERSSPACED MIDDLE OF SHOE JOINTAND EVERY COLLAR TILL GONE. LANDED @
2446' KB. RAN 200' OF 1" PIPE DOWN BACKSIDE. RDMO BILL'S #6 AIR RIG.

RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. HELD SAFETY MEETING.PRESSURE TESTED LINES AND CEMENT VALVE TO 1000
PSIG. PUMPED 175 BBLS FRESH WATER & 20 BBLS GELLED WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT. MIXED &
PUMPED220 SX (149.6 BBLS)OF PREMIUM LEAD CEMENT W/16% GEL, 10#/SX GILSONITE,3#lSX GR-3, 3%
SALT & ¼ #/SX FLOCELE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @ l 1.0 PPG W/YIELD OF 3.82 CF/SX.

TAILED IN Wl200 SX (41 BBLS)OF PREMIUM CEMENTW/2% CACL2 & ¼ #/SX FLOCELE. MIXED TAIL
CEMENT TO 15.8 WlYŒLD OF 1.15 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT W/180 BBLS FRESH WATER. BUMPED PLUG
W/1000# @ 8:04 PM, 1/24/2007. CHECKEDFLOAT, FLOATHELD. SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE. BROKE
CIRCULATION 6 BBLS INTO GELLED WATER. CIRCULATED 30 BBLS LEAD CEMENT TO PIT. CEMENT
STAYED AT SURFACE WHEN PLUG BUMPED.

TOP JOB #l: RAN 200' OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 100 SX (20.4 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT Wl3% CaCl2
& ¼#/SX FLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPGW/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. HOLE FILLED & CIRCULATED20
BBLS LEAD CEMENT TO PIT.HOLE STOOD FULL WHEN PUMPING STOPPED. HOLE FILLED, STOOD FULL.

PREPAREDLOCATION FOR RUTARYRIG.WORT WILL DROP FROM REPORTUNTIL FURTHERACTIVITY.

NO SURVEY AT THIS TIME.
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 057268

DALL COOK NOTIFIED M1KELEE WlVBLMOF THE SURFACECASING & CEMENT JOB ON 1/23/2007 @ l1:30
AM.

02-17-2007 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion 50 Well Total

MD 2,446 TVD 2,446 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREPAIR TO MOVE RIG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 RDRT PREPAIR TO MOVE FROM ECW 10-04 TO ECW11-04. MOVED TRAILERSTO ECW 11-04

18:00 06:00 12.0 WAIT ON DAY LIGHT.

TRANSFERRD FROM ECW 10-04 TO ECW 11-04:

4 JTS 4 1/2" HC P-110 CASING

l JT HC P-110 MARKER JT

3483 GAL RIG FUEL

SAFETY MEETING: RDRT/WATCH OUT FOR ONE ANOTHER

FULL CREWS

NO ACCIDENTS

BOILER 12 HRS

TEMP 53 DEGREES

MOVE FROM ECW 10-04 TO ECW I 1-04 (1/2 MILE)

02-18-2007 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion . Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,446 TVD 2,446 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 HOLD SAFETY MEETING.MOVE RIGTO ECW l1-04.

15:00 16:30 1.5 CUT & SLIP 65' DRILLINGLINE. RIG UP TO RAISE DERRICK.

16:30 17:00 0.5 HOLD SAFETY MEETING.RIG INSPECTION BEFORE RAISING DERRICK.

17:00 18:00 1.0 RAISE DERRICK. RIG UP FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING:RAISING DERRICKIMOVINGRIG

TWO FULL CREWS ON DAYLIGHTS

NOACCIDENTS

TEMP 51 DEGREES

FUEL ON HAND 3483 GALS

18:00 06:00 12.0 SHUT DOWN FOR NIGHT

02-19-2007 Reported By DOUGGRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total '
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Well Name: ECW GI1-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,446 TVD 2.446 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 RIG UP. NIPPLE UP BOP STACK. RIG UP NEW GAS BUSTER LINES.

18:00 06:00 12.0 SHUT DOWN FOR NIGHT.

SAFETY MEETINGS: GOOD COMMUNICATION/HOUSE KEEPING

TWO FULL CREWS ON DAY LIGHTS

NO ACCIDENT

FUEL ON HAND 3483 GALS

TEMP5l DEGREES

02-20-2007 Reported By DOUGGRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion , a Well Total

MD 2.550 TVD 2,550 Progress 104 Days 1 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 NIPPLE UP BOP & RIG UP GAS BUSTER. START DAYWORK AT 06:00 HRS, 2/19/07.

10:00 14:30 4.5 TEST LOWER KELLY, UPPER KELLY, SAFETY VALVES,INSIDE BOP/DART VALVE, PIPE RAMS& INSIDE
VALES, PIPE RAMS, OUTSIDE KILL LINE VALVE & HCR, PIPE RAMS, CHOKE LINE, CHECK VALVE,UP RIGHT
GAGE VALE & INSIDE MANIFOLD VALVES, BLIND RAMS, CHOKE LINE AND MIDDLE MANIFOLD VALVES,
BLIND RAM, CHOLE LINEAND SUPER CHOKETO 250 PSI FOR 5 MINUTES,5,000 PSI FOR 10MINUTES.TEST
ANNULAR TO 250 PSI LOW, 5 MINUTES, 2500 PSI HIGH FOR 10 MINUTES.TEST CASINGTO 1500 PSI FOR 30
MINUTES.

14:30 16:30 2.0 RIG UP PU MACHINE. HELD SAFETY MEETINGWIPU CREW.

16:30 22:30 6.0 PU BIT, BHA. TRIP IN HOLE TO 2392'.

22:30 00:00 1.5 RIG DOWN & LOAD OUT CALIBER PU MACHINE.

00:00 03:30 3.5 DRILL FLOAT EQUIPMENT, CEMENT 2392' TO 2446. DRILL TO 2464'.

03:30 04:00 0.5 FIT TEST 400 PSI FOR 15 MINUTES. KILL MUD @ SHOE 11.6 PPG.
04:00 06:00 2.0 DRILL 2446' TO 2550', 104', 52' PH, WT 3/10, RPM 45, PSI 900, SPM 114, GPM 432.

FORMATION:GREEN RIVER TOP 1959'

BACK GROUND GAS 38U, HIGH GAS 115U@ 2486'

LOGGERON 2/19/07

SAFETY MEETING: PICKING UP DRILL PIPE

SAFETY MEETING WICALIBER CREW

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC

FULL CREWS

NO ACCIDENTS

FUEL ON HAND 10, 136 GALS, USED 724 GALS

MUD WT, WATER
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 057268

TMEP 21 DEGREES

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7 7/8" HOLE AT 04:00 HRS, 2/20/07.

02-21-2007 Reported By DOUGGRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,250 TVD 4.250 Progress 1,700 Days 2 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRLG 2550' TO 2620', 70' @ 35 PH, WT 3/12, RPM 45/67, PSI 900, SPM l14, GPM 432.

08:00 08:30 0.5 WORK ON #2 POP OFF.

08:30 09:00 0.5 DRLG2620' TO 2650', 30' @ 60' PH, WT 10/12, RPM 45/67, PSI 900. SPM l 14. GPM 432.

09:00 09:30 0.5 WlRELINE SURVEY 2612', 1 DEGREE.

09:30 15:00 5.5 DRLG2650' TO 3237', 587' @ 106.72' PH, WT 15/18, RPM 45/67, PSI 925, SPM 114, GPM 432.

15:00 16:00 1.0 RIG SERVICE. REPAIR ROTARY CHAIN.

16:00 16:30 0.5 DRLG3237' TO 3281', 44' @ 88' PH, WT 15/18, RPM 45/67, PSI 925, SPM 114, GPM 432.

16:30 17:00 0.5 WORK ON #1 PUMP, VALVES.

17:00 20:00 3.0 DRLG3281' TO 3547, 266' @ 88.66' PH. WT 15/20, RPM 45/67, PSI 1150, SPM 114, GPM 432.

20:00 20:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 3480', 1 DEGREE.

20:30 04:00 7.5 DRLG3547' TO 4198', 651' @ 86.8' PH, WT 15/20, RPM 45/67, PSI 1150, SPM l14, GPM 432.

04:00 04:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 4198', 2 DEGREES.

04:30 06:00 1.5 DRLG 4198' TO 4250', 52' @ 34.66' PH, WT 15/20, RPM 45/67. PSI 1150. SPM 114, GPM 432.

FORMATION MAHOGANY OIL SHALE TOP 2589', 70% SHALE, 15% SS, 15% LS

BGGAS 420U, CONN GAS 1100U, HIGH GAS 5425U, @ 3046'

MUD WT 9#, VIS 33

SAFETY MEETING: SAFETY POINTS W/NEW HANDS/RIG & TOOL MAINTANCE

FULLCREWS

NOACCIDENTS

FUEL ON HAND 8750 GALS, USEDl386 GALS

BOILER 24 HRS

CHECK CROWN-O-MKTIC

TEMP 21 DEGREES

02-22-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

Daily Costs: Drilling & Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling - Completion Well Total

MD 5,350 TVD 5,350 Progress 1,100 Days 3 MW 8.9 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 DRILL 4250' TO 4787', 59.6' PH, WT 15 TO 18K,RPM 45/67, SPM 114, 412 GPM.
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

15:00 15:30 0.5 WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 4787', 1 3/4 DEG.

15:30 16:00 0.5 DRILL 4787' TO 4803'.

16:00 16:30 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG @CHANGE SWAB IN #1 PUMP.

16:30 02:00 9.5 DRILL 4803' TO 5220'. WOB 18/25K, 50/55 RPMS, 1450 PSI, 20 TO 35'lHR.

02:00 02:30 0.5 LUBRICATERIG.

02:30 06:00 3.5 DRILL 5220' TO 5350', WT 18/25K, 50/55 RPMS. FPH28/35, 1450 PSI.

LITHOLOGY: 50% SH.40% SS, 10% LS

BGS 50U, CONN 200U

MUD 9.3/35

TOP OF UTELAND BUTTE-4740'. TOP OF WASATCH-4872'

SAFETY MEETING WITH BUTH CREWS AND TOOL PUSHER: TAILGATE AND JSA

HELD BOP DRILL AT 4980', KELLY DOWN TO HANDSON STATION, 1 MIN 3 SEC

FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR

PUMP #1 SPR AT4911' 300 PSI/50 STKS

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC

TCYTALFUEL 7849 GALS, USED 901 GALS

ACC 2800 PSI, ANN 1200 PSI

NO ACCIDENTS

02-23-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion f Well Total

MD 6,242 TVD 6.242 Progress 892 Days 4 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 15:00 9.0 DRILL 5350' TO 5652'.9.3 WT, 34 VIS, 50/63 RPM,18/24K, NO TIGHT CONNECTIONS.

15:00 15:30 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC AT 15:30 HRS, DEFITI 5653'.

15:30 01:30 10.0 DRILL5652' TO 6116, WOB 18/20K, 50/63 RPMS.MUD WT 9.3, 35 VIS. BGG 48U.
01:30 02:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC AT 6116', 01:45 AM. #1 PUMP SPR 48-300 PSI.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 6116' TO 6242', WOB 18/20K,50/63 RPMS, 9.4 WT 35 VIS.

BGG45U, CONNECTION 85U, NO TIGHT CONNECTIONS
TOP OF CHAPITA WELLS 5468'. TOP OF BUCK CANYON 6139'

NOTE: NO LOSE ON DRILLING FLUID TO THIS DEFTH 6242'

HIGH GAS 283U PEAK, NO DOME AT 5544'

TUTALFUEL 6916 GALS, USED 933 GALS
HELD SAFETY MEETING WITH BOTH CREWS AND TOOL PUSHER: JSAffAIL GATE

ACC 2800 PSI. ANNULAR 1200 PSI

FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAMSON BOP ALSO CROWN-O-MATIC

02-24-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
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Well Name: ECW 01I-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 057268

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 6,953 TVD 6,953 Progress 711 Days 5 MW 9.4 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 14:30 8.5 DRILL 6242' TO 6550', WOB 18/20K,50/63 RPMS,9.4 WT, 35 VIS, BGG 54U.

14:30 15:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC.

15:00 01:30 10.5 DRILL 6550' TO 6860', WOB 18/25K, 50/63 RPMS,9.5 WT, 35 VIS.

01:30 02:00 0.5 LUBRCATE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC. #1 PUMP SPR, 40 STKS, 285 PSI.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 6860' TO 6953', WOB 20/26K,50/63 RPMS,9.6 WT,35 VIS, BGG 55U, NOTIGHT CONNECTIONS OR LOSS
OF DRILL FLUID.

LITHOLOGY: 60% SS, 40% SH

TOP OF NORTH HORN 742', 1588U AT 6870'

SAFETY MEETING WITH BOTH CREWS AND TOOL PUSHER: MIXING CHEMICALS/JSA # GN-12, MS-02,
03/PINCH POINTS

TOTAL FUEL 5336 GALS, USED 1580 GALS

NOACCIDENTS

02-25-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7.975 TVD 7,975 Progress 1,022 Days 6 MW 9.6 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 DRILL 6953' TO 7139', WOB 20/25K, 50/63 RPMS,9.6 WT, 36 VIS.

09:00 09:30 0.5 RIG REPAIR, TIGHT ROTARY HEAD DOWN.

09:30 15:30 6.0 DRILL 7139' TO 7417', WOB 24/26K,50/63 RPMS, 9.6 WT, 36 VIS.

15:30 16:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAMS. CHECK CROWN-4)-MATIC.

16:00 02:00 10.0 DRILL 7417' TO 7851', WOB 24/26K,50/63 RPMS, 9.7 WT,38 VIS.

02:00 02:30 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O- MATIC. #1 PUMP SPR, 48 STKS, 350 PSI.

02:30 06:00 3.5 DRILL 7851' TO 7975', WOB 26K, 50/63 RPMS, MUD WT 9.7, VIS 40, BGG410U.

LITHOLOGY: 60% SS, 35% SH, 5% SLTSTN

HIGH GAS AT 7553', 4014U

TOP OF ISLAND 7190'

TOP OF KMV PRICE RIVER 7316'

SAFETY MEETING WITH BOTH RIG CREWSAND TOOL PUSHER: JSA @TAIL GATE

ACC 2600 PSI, ANNULAR 1400

TOTAL FUEL 4242 GALS. USED 1094 GALS

NO ACCIDENTS

02-26-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 8,409 TVD 8,409 Progress 434 Days 7 MW 9 8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIPPING IN W/BIT #2

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 DRILL 7975' TO 8350', WOB 26K, 50/63 RPM, 9.8 MUD WT, 38 VIS.

15:30 16:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. CHECKCROWN-O-MATIC. FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAMS.

16:00 21:00 5.0 DRILL 8350' TO 8409', WOB 28K, 50/63 RPMS,MUD WT 9.8. VIS 38, 65% CARB SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTSTN.

21:00 01:30 4.5 PUMP DRY JOB. DROP SURVEY. TRIP OUT FOR NEW BIT AT 8409'.

01:30 02:30 1.0 LAY DOWN 2-3 POINT ROLLER REAMERS, ONE MUD MOTOR.

02:30 03:00 0.5 PICK UP NEW MUD MOTOR, HUNTING .16, MAKE UP BIT HC506Z.

03:00 06:00 3.0 TRIP IN WITH BlT #2 HC506Z. BROKE CIRC AT4495', GOOD DISPLACEMENT.

RECEIVED 241 JTS OF 4.5 CASING, 11.60, N-80, LTC, R-3 & 3 MARKER JTS P-110

TOP OF KMV MIDDLE PRICE RIVER 7972', HIGH GAS AT 7961', 2494U

SAFETY MEETING WASHELD WITH BOTH CREWS AND TOOL PUSHER: JSA, TAIL GATE

NO ACCIDENTS

02-27-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,275 TVD 9,275 Progress 866 Days 8 MW 10.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:30 0.5 FINISH TRIPPING IN WITH BIT #2 AT 4809'.

06:30 07:00 0.5 INSTALL ROTARYHEAD RUBBER.

07:00 15:30 8.5 DRILL 8409' TO 8798', 50/63 RPMS,WOB 18K, WT 9.8, VIS 38.
15:30 16:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC. FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR.

16:00 04:30 12.5 DRILL 8798TO 9262', 50/63 RPMS,WOB 18K, MUD WT 9.8,VIS 40.

04:30 05:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. #1 PUMP SPR 48, 430 PSI.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL 9262' TO 9275', 50/63 RPMS, WOB 16/18K, MUD WT 10.1, VIS 40.

LITHOLOGY: 55% SS, 40% SH, 5% SLTSTN

BGG 3500U. CONECTION 4800U

TOP OF SEGO 9187'

HIGH GAS 4999U AT 8540'

BUTH RIG CREWS HELD SAFETY MEETING WITH TOOL PUSHER: JSA AND TAILGÄTE

TOTAL FUEL 5969 GALS, USED 1572 GALS

NO ACCIDENTS

ACC 3000 PSI, ANNULAR l100 PSI
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

02-28-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

Daily Costs: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 125 Days 9 MW 10.2 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN 4 1/2" CSG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 DRILL 9275' TO 9400' TD, WOB 18/20K,50/63 RPMS, MUD WT 10.2, VIS 40. REACHED AT 10:30 HRS. 2/27/07.

10:30 12:30 2.0 CIRC BOTTOMSUP FOR SHORT TRIP.

12:30 15:00 2.5 MAKE SHORT TRIP OF 20 STDS, NOTIGHT SPOTS.

15:00 17:30 2.5 CIRC/COND HOLEAND MUD FOR LAYINGDP DOWN. PUMPED SAW DUSTSWEEPS.

17:30 18:00 0.5 RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE. HAVE SAFETY MEETINGWITH RIG CREW AND CALIBER LAY DOWN CREW

18:00 03:30 9.5 PUMP SLUG. LAY ALL DRILL PIPE AND BHA DOWN.

03:30 04:30 1.0 PULL WEAR BUSHING FROM CSY HEAD.

04:30 05:30 1.0 RIG UP CASINGCREW (CALIBER).

05:30 06:00 0.5 HELD SAFETY MEETING WITH RIG CREW, CASlNG CREW AND LAY DOWN CREW: SAFETY

COMES FIRST.

NGTIFIED MICHAEL LEE & JAMIE SPARGER W/BLM (LEFT MESSAGE) AT 22:00 HRS, 2/27/07 OF RUNNING4
1/2" CASING/CEMENTING.

TUTAL FUEL 4864', USEDi l05 GALS

NO ACCIDENTS

BUITOMS UP ON SHORT TRIP 5935U

BGG 2400U, CONNECTION 4000U, HIGH GAS 8702U AT 9228'

TOP OF SEGO 9187'

03-01-2007 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion - Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion . Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 SAFETY MEETING W/CALIBER. RIG UP TO PK UP CASING.

07:00 14:30 7.5 PU 236 JTS (233 FULL JTS + 3 MARKER JTS (P-110)) OF 4 1/2", 11.6#, N-80, LTC,PRODUCTION CASING. RAN
AS FOLLOWS: FLOAT SHOE AT 9382.62' KB, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR 9340', 50 JTS CASING,MARKER JT
AT 7318', 71 JTS CASING, MARKER JT AT 4462', 111 JTS CASING, MARKER JT AT 21.75', CASING HANGER &
LANDINGJT. TAG BUITOM. PU LANDING JT. DTO WELL HEAD.

14:30 17:00 2.5 FILL PIPE & CIRC CASING. TOOK ±100 BBLS BEFORE FLOW STARTED, 30' FLARE BOTTOMS UP. CIRC OUT
GAS.

17:00 18:00 1.0 SAFETY MEETINGWISCHLUMBERGER. TEST CEMENT LINESTO 4500 PSI.
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

18:00 19:30 1.5 CEMENTINGWISCHLUMBERGER, LEAD 220 SK'S G HILIFT (YIELD 3.91 FT/3/SX) + 12% DO20, 1% DO79, .

250% Dl12, .2% DO46, .125#/SK DI30, 5% DO44, BWOW, SLURRY WT I1.0 PPG.(153.2 BBL) TAIL W/1490 SK'S
50/50 POZ (YIELD 1.29 FT/3/SX) + 2% D020, .1% DO46, .2% DI67, .2% DO65, 0.1% D013. ( 342.3 BBL) FULL
RETURNS TH SLURRY WT 14.10 PPG, THOUGHOUT JOB, DISP RATE 6.5, DISPLACMENT FLUID FRESH
WATER, BUMPED PLUG W/ 3500 PSI, FLOATSHELD.

19:30 20:00 0.5 LAND CASING W/110,000#. TEST DTO CASING HANGER TO 5,000 PSI. CASING SET @ 9382'. INSTALL SAFETY
VALVEON CASING.

20:00 00:00 4.0 NIPPLE DOWN BOP STACK.CLEAN MUD TANKS.

00:00 06:00 6.0 RDRT. PREPAIR TO MOVE TO SOUTH CHAPITA WELL 24-35.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNING CASING/CEMENTING CASING

FULL CREWS

NOACCIDENTS

BOILER 24 HRS

FUEL ON HAND 4397 GALS, USED 467 GALS

WEATHER NICE

06:00 18.0 RELEASE RIG @ 00:00 HRS (MIDNIGHT), 2/28/07.

CASINGPOINT COST $678,843

03-17-2007 Reported By BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion - Well Total 's

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 13:00 6.0 PRESSURE TESTED CSG & FRACTREE TO 6500 PSIG. WO COMPLETION.

03-27-2007 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 0.0 Perf : 7869'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC UPR

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 19:00 13.0 MIRUCUTIERS WIRELINE PERFORATELPR FROM 9075'-76', 9080'-81', 9094'-95', 9103'-04', 9128'-29',

9141'-42', 9151'-52', 9165'-66', 9172'-73', 9180'-81', 9201'-02' & 9207'-08' @ 3 SPF @ 120° PHASING. RDWL.
MIRUSCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYFYRON T-106, 4187 GAL YFl16ST+ PAD,
45,121 GAL YFl16ST+ WITH 112,600 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6328 PSIG. MTR 42.7 BPM. ATP 5167 PSIG.
ATR 42.7 BPM. ISIP 3640 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET 10K CFP AT 9,050'. PERFORATELPR FROM 8836'-37', 8846'-47', 8862'-64', 8876'-77', 8896'-97',
8902'-03', 8919'-20', 8949'-50', 8973'-74', 8994'-95', 9007'-08', 9012'-13', 9029'-30' @ 2 SPF @ 180° PHASING.
RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYFYRON T-106, 4l61 GAL YF116ST+
PAD, 45,063 GAL YF116ST+WITH 113,600 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6270 PSIG. MTR 45.6 BPM. ATP 5654
PSIG. ATR 38.4 BPM. ISIP 2930 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

RUWLSET 10KCFP AT8.800'. PERFORATEMPRILPRFROM8593'-94', 8605'-06', 8629'-30', 8638'-39',
8652'-53', 8657'-58', 8671'-72', 8679'-80', 8693'-94', 8749'-50', 8759'-60', 8768'-69', 8778'-79', 8783'-84' @ 2
SPF @ 180° PHASING. RDWL.RU SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYVI'RON T-106,
4158 GAL YF116ST+ PAD, 44,730 GAL YF116ST+ WITH I13,800 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP6315 PSlG. MTR
45.6 BPM. ATP 5595 PSIG. ATR 41.3 BPM. ISIP 3340 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET 10K CFP AT 8,565'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8364'427', 8375'-76', 8398'-99', 8404'-05', 8412'-13',
8432'-33', 8449'-51', 8481'-82', 8487'-88', 8522'-23', 8548'-49' @ 2 SPF @ 180° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYFTRON T-106, 4794 GAL YF116ST+ PAD, 53,544
GAL YF116ST+ WITH 140,700 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6426 PSIG. MTR 46 BPM.ATP 5761 PSIG.ATR 40.3
BPM. ISIP 3680 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWLSET 10K CFP AT 8,338'. PERFORATE MPR FROM8129' -30', 8136'-37', 8155'-56', 8230'-31', 8241'-42',
8247'-48', 8272'-73', 8282'-83', 8291'-92', 8308'-09', 8317'-18', 8326'-27' @ 3 SPF @ 120° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4782 GAL YFI16ST+ PAD, 53.724
GAL YF116ST+WITH 143,600 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6205 PSlG. MTR 45.9 BPM. ATP 5154 PSIG.ATR
42.5 BPM. ISIP 3200 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET 10K CFP AT 8,094'. PERFORATE MPRIUPR FROM 7869'-70', 7894'-95', 7920'-21', 7931'-32',
7947'-48', 7964'-65', 7982'-83', 7995'-96', 8010'-1l', 8027'-28', 8037'-38', 8045'-46', 8074'-75', 8079'-80' @ 2
SPF @ 180° PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106,
5207 GAL YFi l6ST+ PAD, 58,843 GALYF116ST+WITH 161,700 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6247 PSIG. MTR
45.6 BPM. ATP 3940 PSIG. ATR 43.4BPM. ISlP 2450 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER. SWIFN.

03-28-2007 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion - Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159' -9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU CLEAN OUT SAND AND DRILL OUT FRACPLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 1772 PSIG. RUWL SET 10K CFP AT 7,800'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7492'-93', 7515'-16', 7533'-34',

7541'-42', 7579'-80', 7587'-88', 7651'-52', 7689'-90', 7740'-41', 7747'-48', 7752'-53', 7768'-69', 7775'-76' @ 2
SPF @ 180° PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH 165 GAL GYFTRON T-106,
4783 GAL YFl16ST+ PAD, 54,269 GAL YFl16ST+ WITH 145,600 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 5951 PSIG. MTR
45.8 BPM. ATP 3999 PSIG. ATR 43.3 BPM. ISIP 2670 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET 10K CFP AT 7,425'. PERFORATE UPR FROM 7159'-60', 7167'-68', 7173'-74', 7196'-97', 7217'-18',
7264'-65', 7286'-87', 7304'-05', 7321'-22', 7331'-32', 7347'-48', 7355'-56', 7377'-78', 7392'-93' @ 2 SPF @ 180°

PHASING.RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH 165 GAL GYFTRON T-106, 4779 GAL
YF116ST+ PAD, 50,031 GAL YFl l6ST+ WITH 132,000 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 5301 PSIG. MTR 45.8 BPM.
ATP 4084 PSIG. ATR 42.9 BPM. ISIP 2480 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET 10K CBP AT 7,055'. BLEED WELL OFF TO OPSIG. RDMOCUTTRS WIRELINE& SCHLUMBERGER.

SPUT IN ROYAL RIG #2 & EQUIPMENT.TOO WINDY TO RIG UP SDFD.

03-29-2007 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 14 Mw 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILL CFPS
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Well Name: ECW 01 I-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 057268

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU ROYAL WELL SERVICE RIG #2. SICP0 PSIG. ND FRAC VALVE. NU BOR RIH WITH 3-7/8" HURRICANE
MILL, POBS, 1-JT 2-3/8" L-80 SRD 4.7#, XN, 214-JTS TUBING TO CBP @ 7055'. SWI. SDFD.

03-30-2007 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TESTING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 0 PSIG. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT CBP @ 7055'. CFPS @ 7425', 7800', 8094', 8338',
8565', 8800', & 9050. RIH. CLEANEDOUT TO 9325'. CIRCULATEDCLEAN. LANDED TUBING @ 7795' KB. ND
BOPE. NU TREE. PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB. RDMOSU.

FLOWED 13 HRS. 16/64 CHOKE. FTP-l250 PSIG. CP-1300 PSIG. 48 BFPH. RECOVERED 668 BLW. 9932 BLWTR.

TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

PUMP OFF SUB .91'

I JT 2-3/8" L-80 8RD 4.7# 32.86'

XN NIPPLE 1.30' 236 JTS 2-3/8" L-80 8RD 4.7# 7743.48'

BELOW KB 16.00' LANDED @ 7794.55'
KB

03-31-2007 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TESTING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64"CHOKE. FTP 1300 PSIG. CP 1100 PSIG. 38 BFPH. RECOVERED976 BLW 8956 BLWTR.

JRS

04-01-2007 Reported By HISLOP

Daily Costs: Drilling 50 Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion f Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TESTING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE.FTP 1150 PSIG. CP 1200 PSIG. 28 BFPH. RECOVERED 712 BLW 8244 BLWTR.

JRS
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

04-02-2007 Reported By HISLOP

Daily Costs: Drilling so Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total i

MD 4400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WAITING ON PRODUCTION FACILITIES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 10 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP I 150 PSIG. CP 1550 PSIG. 21 BFPH. RECOVERED 248 BLW 7996 BLWTR.

SWI @ 4:00 PM. WO FACILITIES.

FINAL COMPLETlON DATE:4/1/07

04-11-2007 Reported By TIGAR MILLER

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total >

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 INITIAL PRODUCTION. OPENING PRESSURE: TP l 100 & CP 3150 PSIG. TURNED WELL TO QUESTARSALES
AT 12:00 PM, 4/9/07. INITIAL RATE 150 MCFD ON 12/64" POS CHOKE.

04-12-2007 Reported By ALAN WATKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 96 MCFD, 45 BC & 360 BW IN 24 HRS ON 12/64" CK, TP 1500 & CP 3000 PSIG. CHANGED CHOKE TO
10/64" POS.

04-13-2007 Reported By ALAN WATKINS

Daily Costs: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total !

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0 0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 194 MCFD, 40 BC & 240 BW IN 24 HRS ON 12/64" CK, TP 1400 & CP 2950 PSIG.

04-16-2007 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling SO Completion 50 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0 0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: ECW 0\ I-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Pmperty: 057268

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 4/14/07 FLOWED206 MCFD, 70 BC & 240 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, TP 1450 & CP 2700 PSIG.

4/15/07 FLOWED214 MCFD, 60 BC & 240 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, TP 1450 & CP 2850 PSIG.

4/16/07 FLOWED 229 MCFD, 40 BC & 230 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, TP 1400 & CP 2800 PSIG.

04-17-2007 Reported By ALAN WATKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion i Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Pogress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES-FINAL REPORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 227 MCFD, 40 BC & 240 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, TP 1400 & CP 2775 PSIG.

FINAL REPORT.
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CORRECTED FROM AN EARLIER SUBMISSION DATED 4/18/2007

Eam 3160-5 UNITEDSTATES EORMAPPROVED
(Eebruary2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR E I 007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSenalNo.
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U *13 4

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,Allottee or TribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnitor CA/Agreement, Nameand/or No.

1. Type of
il Well GasWell Other

8. WellNameand Na
EAST CHAPITA 11-42. NameofOpemtor EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. Phone No.(include area code) 43-047-36825
600 17th St., Suite 1000N. Denver. CO 80202 303-824-5526 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec.,T. R., M, or Survey Description) Natural Buttes/Mesaverde

1926' FSL & 2179' FEL (NWISE) 11. CountyorParish, State
Sec. 4-T9S-R23E 40.063019 LAT 109.330389 LON Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NGITCE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) WawrShut-OfOsouceone war O Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Wellntegty

SubsequentRepoit Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other
O changerians O Plugand Abandon TempomrilyAbandon

OFinal Abandonment Notice Convert© Injection PlugBack WaterDisposal

13. DescribeProposed or CompletedOperation(clearly state all pettinentdetails,includingestimated statting dateofany proposedwork and approximate dumtionthereof
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor æcomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and tme vertical depthsof all pertinentmadcers and zones.
Attach the Bondunder which the work will beperformedor provide the Bond No. on filewith BLM/BIA.Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedopemtions. Iftheoperation results ina multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval,a Form3160-4must be filedonce
testing hasbeencompleted. Final Abandonment Noticesmust be filed only after all requiæments, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthatthesite isready forfinalinspection.)

The referenced well was turned to sales on 4/9/20tY1. Please see the attached operations summary report for drilling and completion operations
performed on the subject well.

RECENED

APR2 3 2007

y OF0\L,GAS M\N\NG

14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Tvped)

Mary A. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant

Signature Date 04/20/20tf1

THIS SPAÒE F FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

.Aigov Title Date .

Conditionsof approval, ifany, are attached. Approval of thisnotice doesnot warant or
certify that the applicant holdslegalor equitable title to thoserights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle theapplicant toconduct operationsthereon.
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crime forany person knowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
Statesany false.fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representationsas to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page 2)



WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 04-18-2007

Well Name ECW 011-04 Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA WELLS DEEP API # 43-047-36825 Well Class ISA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 02-20--2007 Class Date 04-09-2007

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9,400/ 9,400 Property # 057268

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0
KB / GL Elev 4,988/ 4,972

Location Section 4. T9S, R23E, NWSE. 1926 FSL & 2179 FEL

Event No I.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE
Operator EOG RESOURCES INC. WI % 100.0 NRI % 84.75

AFE No 303481 AFE Total DHC/ CWC
Rig Contr ENSIGN Rig Name ENSIGN #72 Start Date 01-05-2007 Release Date 02-28-2007

07-07-2005 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

1815' FSL & 1969' FEL (NW/SE)

SECTION 4, T95. R23E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

LAT 40.062747, LONG 109.328956 (NAD 27)

RIG: ENSIGN #72

OBJECTIVE: 9400' TD, WASATCH
DW/GAS

EAST CHAPITA PROSPECT

DD&A: CHAPITA DEEP

NATURALBUTTES FIELD

LEASE: U--01304

ELEVATION: 4972.7' NAT GL, 4971.5' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING 4972' ISTHE PREP GL), 4988' KB (16')

EOG WI 100%, NRI 84.75%

12-29-2006 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total



Well Name: ECW 011-4)4 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Pmperty:057268

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONSTARTED.

01-02-2007 Reported By BRYON TOLMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION 40% COMPLETE.

01-03-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION STARTED.

01-04-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days O MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 ROCKED OUT DRILLING.

01-05-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHINGOUT PIT.

01-08-2007 Reported By BRYON TOLMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0
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Well Name: ECW 0\ I-04 Field:CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHING OUT PIT.

01-09-2007 Reported By BRYON TOLMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total i

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHING OUT P1T.

01-10-2007 Reported By BRYON TOLMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD o TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0 0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0 0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHINGOUT PIT.

01-11-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: DriHing 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PUSHING OUT PIT.

01-12-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total i

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LINING PIT.

01-15-2007 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITAWELLS DEEP Property: 057268

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION COMPLETE.

01-19-2007 Reported By KAYLENEGARDNER

Daily Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total 50
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 40 TVD 40 Progress 0 Days I MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WO AIR RIG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 ROCKY MOUNTAIN DRILLING SPUD AN 20" HOLE ON 1/17/2007 @5:30 PM. SET 40' OF 14" CONDUCTOR.

CEMENT TO SURFACEWITH READY MIX.JERRYBARNESNOTIFIEDMICHAEL LEE W/BLM AND CAROL
DANIELS WIUDOGMOF THE SPUD 1/17/2007 @ 4:30 PM.

01-30-2007 Reported By JERRY BARNES

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total 5 I

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion $0 Well Total

MD 2,446 TVD 2.446 Progress 0 Days 2 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WO AIR RIG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU BILL JR'S AIR RIG #6 ON 1/21/2007. DRILLED 12-1/4" HOLETO 2460' GL ENCOUNTERED 1620' WATER.

RAN 59 JTS (2430') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#lFT, J-55, ST&CCASING WITH WEATHERFORD GUIDE SHOEAND FLOAT
COLLAR. 8 CENTRALIZERSSPACEDMIDDLEOF SHOE JOINT AND EVERYCOLLARTILL GONE. LANDED @
2446' KB. RAN 200' OF 1" PIPE DOWN BACKSIDE.RDMO BILL'S #6 AIR RIG.

RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINES AND CEMENT VALVE TO 1000
PSIG. PUMPED 175 BBLS FRESH WATER& 20 BBLS GELLED WATERFLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT. MIXED&
PUMPED 220 SX (149.6 BBLS)OF PREMIUM LEAD CEMENT W/16% GEL, 10#/SXGILSONITE,3#/SX GR-3, 3%
SALT & ¼ #/SX FLOCELE. MIXED LEAD CEMENT @ 11.0 PPG WlYIELD OF 3.82 CF/SX.

TAILED IN W/200 SX (41 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT Wl2% CACL2 & ¼ #/SX FLOCELE. MIXED TAIL
CEMENT TO 15.8 WlYIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. DISPLACED CEMENT W/180 BBLS FRESH WATER.BUMPED PLUG
W/l000# @ 8:04 PM, 1/24/2007. CHECKEDFLOAT, FLOAT HELD. SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. BROKE
CIRCULATION 6 BBLS INTOGELLED WATER. CIRCULATED 30 BBLS LEAD CEMENT TO PIT. CEMENT
STAYED AT SURFACEWHEN PLUG BUMPED.

TOP JOB #1: RAN 200' OF 1" PIPE. MIXED & PUMPED 100 SX (20.4 BBLS) OF PREMIUMCEMENTWl3% CaCl2
& ¼#/SX FLOCELE.MIXEDCEMENT @ 15.8PPG W/YIELD OF l.15 CF/SX. HOLE FILLED& CIRCULATED 20
BBLS LEAD CEMENTTO PIT HOLE STOOD FULLWHEN PUMPINGSTOPPED.HOLE FILLED, STOODFULL.

PREPARED LOCATION FOR RUTARY RIG. WORT WILL DROP FROMREPORT UNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

NO SURVEYAT THIS TIME.
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

DALL COOK NOTIFIEDMIKE LEE WlVBLM OF THE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 1/23/2007 @ I I:30
AM.

02-17-2007 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion so Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion 50 Well Total

MD 2,446 TVD 2,446 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREPAIR TO MOVE RIG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 18:00 12.0 RDRT PREPAIR TO MOVEFROMECW 10-04 TO ECW11-04. MOVEDTRAILERSTO ECW 11-04

18:00 06:00 I2.0 WAITON DAY LIGHT.

TRANSFERRD FROM ECW 10-04 TO ECW 11-04:

4 JTS 4 1/2" HC P-110 CASING

lJTHCP-I10MARKERJT

3483 GAL RIG FUEL

SAFETY MEETING: RDRT/WATCH OUT FOR ONE ANGTHER

FULL CREWS

NO ACCIDENTS

BOILER 12 HRS

TEMP 53 DEGREES
MOVE FROM ECW 104)4 TO ECW 11-04 (1/2 MILE)

02-18-2007 Reported By DOUGGRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion . Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2.446 TVD 2,446 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 15:00 9.0 HOLD SAFETY MEETING.MOVE RIG TO ECW 11-04.

15:00 16:30 1.5 CUT & SLIP 65' DRILLINGLINE. RIG UP TO RAISE DERRICK.

16:30 17:00 0.5 HOLD SAFETY MEETING.RIG INSPECTION BEFORERAISING DERRICK.
17:00 18:00 1.0 RAISE DERRICK. RIG UP FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING:RAISING DERRICK/MOVINGRIG

TWO FULL CREWS ON DAYLIGHTS
NOACCIDENTS

TEMP 51 DEGREES

FUEL ON HAND 3483 GALS

18:00 06:00 12.0 SHUT DOWN FOR NIGHT

02-19-2007 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total '
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 057268

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,446 TVD 2,446 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 18:00 12.0 RIG UP NIPPLE UP BOP STACK. RIG UP NEW GAS BUSTER LINES.
18:00 06:00 12.0 SHUT DOWN FOR NIGHT.

SAFETY MEETINGS:GOOD COMMUNICATION/HOUSE KEEPING

TWO FULL CREWS ON DAYLIGHTS
NO ACCIDENT

FUEL ON HAND 3483 GALS
TEMP51 DEGREES

02-20-2007 Reported By DOUGGRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion - , Well Total

MD 2,550 TVD 2,550 Progress 104 Days 1 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 NIPPLE UP BOP & RIG UP GAS BUSTER. START DAYWORK AT 06:00 HRS, 2/19/07.
10:00 14:30 4.5 TEST LOWER KELLY, UPPER KELLY, SAFETY VALVES,INSIDE BOP/DARTVALVE,PIPE RAMS& INSIDE

VALES, PIPE RAMS, OUTSIDE KILL LINE VALVE & HCR, PIPE RAMS, CHOKE LINE, CHECK VALVE,UP RIGHT
GAGE VALE & INSIDE MANIFOLD VALVES, BLIND RAMS, CHOKE LINE AND MIDDLE MANIFOLD VALVES,
BLIND RAM, CHOLE LINE AND SUPER CHOKE TO 250 PSI FOR 5 MINUTES, 5,000 PSI FOR 10 MINUTES.TEST
ANNULAR TO 250 PSI LOW, 5 MINUTES, 2500 PSI HIGH FOR 10 MINUTES. TEST CASINGTO 1500 PSI FOR 30
MINUTES.

14:30 16:30 2.0 RIG UP PU MACHINE. HELD SAFETY MEETING WIPUCREW.
16:30 22:30 6.0 PU BIT, BHA. TRIP IN HOLE TO 2392'.

22:30 00:00 1.5 RIG DOWN & LOADOUT CALIBER PU MACHINE.
00:00 03:30 3.5 DRILL FLOAT EQUIPMENT, CEMENT 2392' TO 2446. DRILL TO 2464'.
03:30 04:00 0.5 FIT TEST 400 PSI FOR 15 MINUTES.KILL MUD @ SHOE 11.6 PPG.
04:00 06:00 2.0 DRILL 2446' TO 2550', 104', 52' PH, WT 3/10, RPM 45. PSI 900, SPM 114, GPM 432.

FORMATION:GREEN RIVER TOP 1959'

BACK GROUND GAS 38U, HIGH GAS 115U @ 2486'

LOGGER ON 2/19/07

SAFETY MEETING: PICKING UP DRILL PIPE

SAFETY MEETING W/CALIBER CREW

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC

FULL CREWS
NO ACCIDENTS
FUEL ON HAND 10, 136 GALS, USED 724 GALS

MUD WT, WATER
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

TMEP 21 DEGREES

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7 7/8" HOLE AT 04:00 HRS, 2/20/07.

02-21-2007 Reported By DOUGGRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion : Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,250 TVD 4,250 Progress 1,700 Days 2 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRLG 2550' TO 2620', 70' @ 35 PH, WT 3/12, RPM 45/67, PSI 900, SPM 114, GPM 432.

08:00 08:30 0.5 WORK ON #2 POP OFF.

08:30 09:00 0.5 DRLG 2620' TO 2650', 30' @60' PH, WT 10/12, RPM 45/67, PSI 900, SPM 114, GPM 432.

09:00 09:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY2612', I DEGREE.

09:30 15:00 5.5 DRLG 2650' TO 3237', 587' @ 106.72' PH, WT 15/18. RPM 45/67, PSI 925, SPM 114, GPM 432.

15:00 16:00 1.0 RIG SERVICE. REPAIR ROTARY CHAIN.

16:00 16:30 0.5 DRLG 3237' TO 3281', 44' @ 88' PH, WT 15/18, RPM 45/67, PSI 925, SPM 114, GPM 432.

16:30 17:00 0.5 WORK ON #1 PUMP, VALVES.

17:00 20:00 3.0 DRLG 3281' TO 3547, 266' @ 88.66' PH. WT 15/20, RPM 45/67, PSI 1150, SPM 114, GPM 432.

20:00 20:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 3480', 1 DEGREE.

20:30 04:00 7.5 DRLG 3547' TO 4198', 651' @ 86.8' PH, WT 15/20, RPM 45/67, PSI 1150. SPM 114, GPM 432.

04:00 04:30 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY @ 4198', 2 DEGREES.

04:30 06:00 1.5 DRLG 4198' TO 4250', 52' @ 34.66' PH, WT 15/20. RPM 45/67, PSI 1150. SPM 114. GPM 432.

FORMATION MAHOGANY OIL SHALE TOP 2589', 70% SHALE, 15% SS, 15% LS
BG GAS420U, CONN GAS l100U, HIGH GAS 5425U, @ 3046'

MUD WT 9#, VIS 33

SAFETY MEETING: SAFETY POINTS WINEW HANDS/RIG & TOOL MAINTANCE

FULL CREWS

NOACCIDENTS

FUELON HAND 8750 GALS, USEDI386 GALS
BOILER 24 HRS

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC

TEMP 21 DEGREES

02-22-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

DailyCosts: Drilling & Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling - Completion Well Total

MD 5,350 TVD 5,350 Progress 1,100 Days 3 MW 8.9 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 15:00 9.0 DRILL4250' TO 4787', 59.6' PH, WT 15 TO ISK, RPM 45/67, SPM 114, 412 GPM.
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

15:00 15:30 0.5 WIRE LINE SURVEY AT 4787', 1 3/4 DEG.

15:30 16:00 0.5 DRILL 4787' TO 4803'.

16:00 16:30 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG @ CHANGE SWAB IN #1 PUMP.
16:30 02:00 9.5 DRILL 4803' TO 5220', WOB 18/25K, 50/55 RPMS, 1450 PSI, 20 TO 35'/HR.

02:00 02:30 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG.

02:30 06:00 3.5 DRILL 5220' TO 5350', WT 18/25K,50/55 RPMS, FPH28/35, 1450 PSI.

LITHOLOGY: 50% SH, 40% SS, 10% LS

BGS SOU, CONN 200U

MUD 9.3/35

TOP OF UTELANDBUTTE-4740', TOP OF WASATCH--4872'

SAFETY MEETING WITH BUTH CREWS AND TOOL PUSHER: TAILGATE AND JSA

HELD BOP DRILL AT 4980', KELLY DOWN TO HANDSON STATION. l MIN 3 SEC

FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR

PUMP #1 SPR AT4911' 300 PSI/50 STKS

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC

TOTAL FUEL 7849 GALS. USED 901 GALS

ACC 2800 PSI, ANN 1200 PSI

NOACCIDENTS

02-23-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion I Well Total

MD 6.242 TVD 6,242 Progress 892 Days 4 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 15:00 9.0 DRILL 5350' TO 5652', 9.3 WT, 34 VIS, 50/63 RPM,l8/24K, NO TIGHT CONNECTIONS.
15:00 15:30 0.5 LUBRICATERIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC AT 15:30 HRS, DEFTH 5653'.
15:30 01:30 10.0 DRILL5652' TO 6116, WOB 18/20K,50/63 RPMS. MUD WT 9.3, 35 VIS. BGG 48U.
01:30 02:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC AT 6116', 01:45 AM. #1 PUMP SPR 48-300 PSI.
02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 6116' TO 6242', WOB 18/20K, 50/63 RPMS, 9.4 WT 35 VIS.

BGG45U, CONNECTION 85U, NO TIGHT CONNECTIONS
TOP OF CHAPITA WELLS 5468', TOP OF BUCK CANYON 6139'

NGUE: NO LOSE ON DRILLINGFLUID TO THIS DEFTH 6242'
HIGH GAS 283U PEAK, NO DOME AT 5544'

TOTALFUEL 6916 GALS, USED 933 GALS
HELD SAFETY MEETING WITH BOTH CREWS AND TOOL PUSHER: JSA/TAILGATE
ACC 2800 PSI, ANNULAR 1200 PSI

FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAMS ON BOP ALSOCROWN-O-MATIC

02-24-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
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Well Name: ECW 01I-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 6.953 TVD 6,953 Progress 7 I 1 Days 5 MW 9.4 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 14:30 8.5 DRILL6242' TO 6550', WOB 18/20K, 50/63 RPMS,9.4 WT, 35 VIS, BGG 54U.
14:30 15:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC.

15:00 01:30 10.5 DRILL 6550' TO 6860', WOB 18/25K, 50/63 RPMS, 9.5 WT, 35 VIS.

01:30 02:00 0.5 LUBRCATE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC. #1 PUMP SPR, 40 STKS, 285 PSI.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 6860' TO 6953', WOB 20/26K. 50/63 RPMS, 9.6 WT, 35 VIS, BGG 55U, NOTIGHT CONNECTIONSOR LOSS
OF DRILL FLUID.

LITHOLOGY: 60% SS, 40% SH

TOP OF NORTH HORN 742', 1588UAT 6870'

SAFETY MEETINGWITH BUTH CREWS AND TOOL PUSHER: MIXING CHEMICALS/JSA # GN-12, MS-02,
03/PINCH POINTS

TOTAL FUEL 5336 GALS. USED 1580 GALS

NO ACCIDENTS

02-25-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion : Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,975 TVD 7,975 Progress 1,022 Days 6 MW 9.6 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 DRILL 6953' TO 7139', WOB 20/25K, 50/63 RPMS, 9.6 WT 36 VIS.

09:00 09:30 0.5 RIG REPAIR, TIGHT RUTARY HEAD DOWN.

09:30 15:30 6.0 DRILL 7139' TO 7417', WOB 24/26K,50/63 RPMS, 9.6 WT, 36 VIS.
15:30 16:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAMS. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC.

16:00 02:00 10.0 DRILL 7417' TO 7851', WOB 24/26K, 50/63 RPMS,9.7 WT, 38 VIS.

02:00 02:30 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O- MATIC.#1 PUMP SPR, 48 STKS, 350 PSI.

02:30 06:00 3.5 DRILL 7851' TO 7975', WOB 26K, 50/63 RPMS, MUD WT 9.7, VIS 40, BGG 410U.

LITHOLOGY: 60% SS, 35% SH, 5% SLTSTN

HIGH GAS AT 7553', 4014U

TOP OF ISLAND 7190'

TOP OF KMV PRICE RIVER 7316'

SAFETY MEETINGWITH BUTH RIG CREWS AND TOOL PUSHER: JSA CeTAIL GATE

ACC 2600 PSI, ANNULAR 1400

TUFAL FUEL 4242 GALS. USED 1094 GALS
NO ACCIDENTS

02-26-2007 Reported B DEMPSE A
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Well Name: ECW 01I-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 8,409 TVD 8,409 Progress 434 Days 7 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIPPING IN W/BIT #2

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 15:30 9.5 DRILL 7975' TO 8350', WOB 26K, 50/63 RPM, 9.8 MUD WT, 38 VIS.

15:30 16:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC. FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAMS.
16:00 21:00 5.0 DRILL 8350' TO 8409', WOB 28K, 50/63 RPMS, MUD WT 9.8, VIS 38, 65% CARB SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTSTN.
21:00 01:30 4.5 PUMP DRY JOB. DROP SURVEY. TRIP OUT FOR NEW BITAT 8409'.

01:30 02:30 1.0 LAY DOWN 2-3 POINT ROLLER REAMERS,ONE MUD MOTOR.

02:30 03:00 0.5 PICK UP NEW MUD MOTOR,HUNTING .16. MAKE UP BIT HC506Z.
03:00 06:00 3.0 TRIP IN WITH BIT #2 HC506Z. BROKE CIRC AT 4495', GOOD DISPLACEMENT.

RECEIVED 241 JTS OF 4.5 CASING, 11.60, N-80, LTC,R-3 & 3 MARKER JTS P-110

TOP OF KMV MIDDLE PRICE RIVER 7972', HIGH GAS AT 7961', 2494U

SAFETY MEETINGWAS HELD WITH BUTH CREWSAND TOOL PUSHER: JSA, TAIL GATE
NO ACCIDENTS

02-27-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9.275 TVD 9,275 Progress 866 Days 8 MW 10.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:30 0.5 FINISH TRIPPING IN WITH BIT #2 AT 4809'.

06:30 07:00 0.5 INSTALLRUTARYHEAD RUBBER.

07:00 15:30 8.5 DRILL 8409' TO 8798', 50/63 RPMS,WOB 18K, WT 9.8, VIS 38.
15:30 16:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC. FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR.
16:00 04:30 12.5 DRILL 8798 TO 9262', 50/63 RPMS, WOB 18K, MUD WT 9.8,VIS 40.
04:30 05:00 0.5 LUBRICATE RIG. #1 PUMP SPR 48, 430 PSI.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL9262' TO 9275', 50/63 RPMS,WOB 16/18K, MUD WT 10.1, VIS 40.

LITHOLOGY: 55% SS, 40% SH, 5% SLTSTN

BGG 3500U, CONECTION 4800U

TOP OF SEGO 9187'

HIGH GAS 4999UAT 8540'

BUTH RIG CREWS HELD SAFETY MEETING WITH TOOL PUSHER: JSA AND TAILGATE
TOTAL FUEL 5969 GALS, USED 1572 GALS

NO ACCIDENTS
ACC 3000 PSI, ANNULAR 1100 PSI
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 057268

02-28-2007 Reported By DEMPSEY DAY

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 125 Days 9 MW 10.2 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN 4 1/2" CSG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:30 4.5 DRILL 9275' TO 9400' TD, WOB 18/20K,50/63 RPMS,MUD WT 10.2, VIS 40. REACHED AT 10:30 HRS, 2/27/07.
10:30 12:30 2.0 CIRC BOTTOMSUP FOR SHORT TRIP.

12:30 15:00 2.5 MAKESHORT TRIP OF 20 STDS, NOTIGHT SPUFS.
15:00 17:30 2.5 CIRC/COND HOLE AND MUD FOR LAYlNGDP DOWN. PUMPED SAW DUST SWEEPS.
17:30 18:00 0.5 RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE. HAVE SAFETY MEETING WITH RIG CREW AND CALIBER LAY DOWN CREW.

18:00 03:30 9.5 PUMP SLUG. LAY ALL DRILL PIPE AND BHA DOWN.

03:30 04:30 1.0 PULL WEAR BUSHING FROM CSY HEAD.

04:30 05:30 1.0 RIG UP CASING CREW (CALIBER).

05:30 06:00 0.5 HELD SAFETY MEETINGWITH RIGCREW, CASING CREW AND LAY DOWN CREW: SAFETY

COMES FIRST.

NJflFIED MICHAEL LEE & JAMIE SPARGER WIBLM (LEFT MESSAGE) AT 22:00 HRS, 2/27/07 OF RUNNING4
I/2" CASING/CEMENTING.

TOTAL FUEL 4864', USED1105 GALS
NO ACCIDENTS

BUITOMS UP ON SHORT TRIP 5935U

BGG 2400U, CONNECTION 4000U, HIGHGAS 8702U AT 9228'

TOP OF SEGO 9187'

03-01-2007 Reported By DOUG GRINOLDS

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion + Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion - Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 10 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WOCOMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 SAFETY MEETING WICALIBER. RIG UP TO PK UP CASING.
07:00 14:30 7.5 PU 236 JTS (233 FULL JTS+ 3 MARKER JTS (P-110)) OF 4 1/2", 11.6#, N-80, LTC,PRODUCTION CASING. RAN

AS FOLLOWS:FLOAT SHOE AT 9382.62' KB, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR 9340', 50 JTS CASING, MARKER JT
AT7318', 71 JTS CASING, MARKERJT AT 4462', 111 JTS CASING, MARKERJT AT21.75', CASING HANGER&
LANDINGJT. TAG BOTTOM. PU LANDINGJT. DTO WELL HEAD.

14:30 17:00 2.5 FILL PIPE & CIRC CASING. TOOK ±100 BBLS BEFORE FLOW STARTED, 30' FLARE BOTTOMS UP. CIRC OUT
GAS.

17:00 18:00 1.0 SAFETY MEETING W/SCHLUMBERGER. TEST CEMENT LINES TO 4500 PSI.
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Well Name: ECW 01I-04 Ficid: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

18:00 19:30 1.5 CEMENTING WISCHLUMBERGER, LEAD 220 SK'S G HILIFT(YIELD 3.91 FT/3/SX)+ 12% DO20, 1% DO79, .

250% D112, .2% DO46, .125#lSK DI30, 5% DO44, BWOW, SLURRY WT 11.0 PPG.(153.2BBL) TAILW/1490 SK'S
50/50 POZ(YlELD 1.29 FT/3/SX) + 2% DO20, .1% DO46, .2% D167, .2% DO65, 0.1% D013. ( 342.3 BBL) FULL
RETURNSTH SLURRY WT 14.10 PPG,THOUGHOUT JOB, DISP. RATE 6.5, DISPLACMENTFLUID FRESH
WATER, BUMPED PLUG W/ 3500 PSI, FLOATSHELD.

19:30 20:00 0.5 LAND CASING Wl110,000#. TEST DTO CASING HANGER TO 5,000 PSI. CASING SET @ 9382'. INSTALLSAFETY
VALVEON CASING.

20:00 00:00 4.0 NIPPLEDOWN BOP STACK.CLEAN MUDTANKS.
00:00 06:00 6.0 RDRT. PREPAIR TO MOVETO SOUTH CHAPITA WELL 24-35.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNINGCASING/CEMENTINGCASING
FULL CREWS

NO ACCIDENTS

BOILER24 HRS

FUELON HAND 4397 GALS, USED 467 GALS

WEATHER NICE

06:00 18.0 RELEASE RIG @ 00:00 HRS (MIDNIGHT), 2/28/07.

CASING POINT COST $678,843

03-17-2007 Reported By BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion - Well Total i

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 11 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 13:00 6.0 PRESSURE TESTED CSG & FRAC TREE TO 6500 PSIG. WO COMPLETION.

03-27-2007 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 12 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 0.0 Perf : 7869'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRAC UPR

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 19:00 13.0 MIRUCUTTERS WIRELINE PERFORATELPR FROM 9075'-76', 9080'-81', 9094'-95', 9103'-04', 9128'-29',

9141' -42', 9151'-52', 9165'-66', 9172'-73', 9180'-81', 9201'-02' & 9207'-08' @ 3 SPF @ 120° PHASING.RDWL.
MIRUSCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH 165 GAL GYFTRON T-106, 4187 GALYF116ST+ PAD,
45.121 GAL YF116ST+WITH I12,600 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6328 PSIG. MTR 42.7 BPM. ATP 5167 PSIG.
ATR 42.7 BPM. ISIP 3640 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET 10K CFP AT 9,050'. PERFORATE LPR FROM 8836'-37', 8846'47', 8862'-64', 8876'-77', 8896'-97',
8902'-03', 8919'-20', 8949'-50', 8973'-74', 8994'-95', 900T-08', 9012'-13', 9029'-30' @ 2 SPF @ 180° PHASING.
RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4161 GAL YF116ST+
PAD, 45.063 GAL YF116ST+ WITH 113,600 # 20/40 SAND @ I-5 PPG. MTP 6270 PSIG. MTR 45.6 BPM. ATP 5654
PSIG.ATR 38.4 BPM. ISIP 2930 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
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Well Name: ECW011-04 Field: CHAPITAWELLS DEEP Property:057268

RUWLSET 10K CFP AT8,800'. PERFORATEMPR/LPRFROM 8593'-94', 8605'-06', 8629'-30', 8638'-39',
8652'-53', 8657'-58', 8671'-72', 8679'-80', 8693'-94', 8749'-50', 8759'-60', 8768'-69', 8778'-79', 8783'-84' @ 2
SPF @ 180° PHASING. RDWL.RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106,
4158 GAL YF116ST+PAD, 44,730 GAL YF116ST+ WITH I13,800 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6315 PSIG. MTR
45.6 BPM. ATP 5595 PSIG.ATR 41.3 BPM. ISIP 3340 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET 10K CFP AT 8,565'. PERFORATE MPR FROM 8364'-67', 8375'-76', 8398'-99', 8404'-05', 8412'-13',
8432'-33', 8449'-51', 8481'-82', 8487'-88', 8522'-23', 8548'-49' @ 2 SPF @ 180° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASlNG WITH 165 GAL GYFTRON T-106, 4794 GAL YF116ST+ PAD, 53,544
GAL YF116ST+ WITH 140,700 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6426 PSIG. MTR 46 BPM. ATP 5761 PSIG. ATR 40.3
BPM. ISIP 3680 PSlG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWLSET 10K CFP AT8,338'. PERFORATEMPR FROM 8129'-30', 8136'-37', 8155'-56', 8230'-31', 8241'-42',
8247'-48', 8272'-73', 8282'-83', 8291'-92', 8308'--09', 8317'-18', 8326'-27' @ 3 SPF @ 120° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYFYRON T-106, 4782 GAL YF1165T+ PAD, 53,724
GAL YFI16ST+ WITH 143,600 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6205 PSIG. MTR 45.9 BPM. ATP5154 PSIG. ATR
42.5 BPM. ISIP 3200 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET 10K CFP AT 8,094'. PERFORATE MPR/UPRFROM 7869'-70', 7894'-95', 7920'-21', 7931'-32',
7947'-48', 7964'-65', 7982'-83', 7995'-96', 8010'-11', 8027'-28', 8037'-38', 8045'-46', 8074'-75', 8079'-80' @ 2
SPF @ 180° PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106,
5207 GAL YF116ST+PAD, 58,843 GAL YF116ST+ WITH 161,700 # 20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6247 PSIG. MTR
45.6 BPM. ATP 3940 PSIG. ATR 43.4BPM. ISIP 2450 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER. SWIFN.

03-28-2007 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion - Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159' -9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRUSU CLEAN OUT SAND AND DRILL OUT FRACPLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 1772 PSIG. RUWL SET 10K CFP AT 7,800'. PERFORATEUPR FROM 7492'-93', 75l5'-16', 7533'-34',

7541'-42', 7579'-80', 7587'-88', 765l'-52', 7689'-90', 7740'-41', 7747'-48', 7752'-53', 7768'-69', 7775'-76' @ 2
SPF @ 180° PHASING.RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYFTRON T-106,
4783 GAL YF116ST+PAD, 54,269 GAL YF116ST+ WITH 145,600 # 20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 5951 PSIG. MTR
45.8 BPM. ATP 3999 PSIG. ATR 43.3 BPM. ISIP 2670 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET 10K CFP AT 7,425'. PERFORATEUPR FROM7159'-60', 7167'-68', 7173'-74', 7196'-97', 7217'-18',
7264'-65', 7286'-87', 7304'-05', 7321'-22', 7331'-32', 7347'-48', 7355'-56', 7377'-78'.7392'-93' @ 2 SPF @ 180°
PHASING. RDWL RU SCHLUMBERGER, FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYFTRON T-106, 4779 GAL
YFl16ST+ PAD, 50,031 GALYF116ST+ WITH 132,000 #20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 5301 PSIG. MTR 45.8 BPM.
ATP 4084 PSIG. ATR 42.9 BPM. ISIP 2480 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWLSET 10K CBP AT 7,055'. BLEED WELL OFF TO 0 PSIG. RDMOCUTTRSWIRELINE& SCHLUMBERGER.

SPOT IN ROYAL RIG #2 & EQUIPMENT TOO WINDY TO RIG UP. SDFD.

03-29-2007 Reported By HISLOP

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLCFPS
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Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITAWELLS DEEP Property:057268

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU ROYALWELL SERVICERIG#2. SICP0 PSIG. ND FRACVALVE. NU BOP RIH WITH 3-7/8" HURRICANE

MILL, POBS, I-JT 2-3/8" L-80 SRD 4.7#, XN, 214-JTS TUBING TO CBP @ 7055'. SWI. SDFD.

03-30-2007 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TESTING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 0 PSIG. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT CBP @ 7055'. CFPS @ 7425'. 7800', 8094', 8338',

8565', 8800'. & 9050. RIH. CLEANED OUT TO 9325'. CIRCULATEDCLEAN. LANDED TUBING @ 7795' KB. ND
BOPE. NU TREE. PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB. RDMOSU.

FLOWED 13 HRS. 16/64CHOKE. FTP-1250 PSlG. CP-1300 PSIG. 48 BFPH. RECOVERED 668 BLW. 9932 BLWTR.

TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

PUMP OFF SUB .91'

1 JT 2-3/8" L-80 8RD 4.7# 32.86'

XN NIPPLE 1.30' 236 JTS 2-3/8" L-80 8RD 4.7# 7743.48'
BELOW KB 16.00' LANDED @ 7794.55'
KB

03-31-2007 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TESTING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1300 PSIG. CP 1100 PSIG. 38 BFPH. RECOVERED 976 BLW 8956 BLWTR.

JRS

04-01-2007 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion I Well Total
MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TESTING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1150 PSIG. CP 1200 PSIG. 28 BFPH. RECOVERED 712 BLW 8244 BLWTR.

JRS
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Well Name: ECW 01 I-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 057268

04-02-2007 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WAITINGON PRODUCTION FACILITIES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 10 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1150 PSIG. CP 1550 PSIG. 21 BFPH.RECOVERED248 BLW 7996 BLWTR.

SW1 @ 4:00 PM. WO FACILITIES.

FINAL COMPLETION DATE: 4/1/07

04-11-2007 Reported By TIGAR MILLER

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total 50
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 9.400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 INITIAL PRODUCTION. OPENING PRESSURE: TP 1100 & CP 3150 PSIG. TURNED WELL TO QUESTAR SALES

AT 12:00 PM, 4/9/07. INITIAL RATE 150 MCFD ON 12/64" POS CHOKE.

04-12-2007 Reported By ALAN WATKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion 50 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf: 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 96 MCFD, 45 BC & 360 BW IN 24 HRSON 12/64" CK, TP 1500 & CP 3000 PSIG.CHANGED CHOKETO

10/64" POS.

04-13-2007 Reported By ALAN WATKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total 50
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total !

MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 194 MCFD, 40 BC & 240 BW IN 24 HRS ON 12/64" CK, TP 1400 & CP 2950 PSIG.

04-16-2007 Reported By ROBERT WILKINS

Daily Costs: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 9,400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'--9208' PKR Depth : 0.0
Page



Well Name: ECW 011-04 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property:057268

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 4/14/07 FLOWED 206 MCFD, 70 BC & 240 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, TP 1450 & CP 2700 PSlG.

4/15/07 FLOWED 214 MCFD, 60 BC & 240 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, TP 1450 & CP 2850 PSIG.

4/16/07 FLOWED 229 MCFD, 40 BC & 230 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, TP 1400 & CP 2800 PSIG.
04-17-2007 Reported By ALANWATKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion ? Well Total

MD 9.400 TVD 9,400 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9340.0 Perf : 7159'-9208' PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES-FINAL REPORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 227 MCFD, 40 BC & 240 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK, TP 1400 & CP 2775 PSIG.

FINAL REPORT.
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Form 3160.5 UNITEDSTATES EORMAPPROVED
(Februaty2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR E 007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U *130'

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,AllotteeorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

1. Type of
1Well g GasWell Other 8. WellNameand Na

EAST CHAPITA 11-4
2. NameofOperator EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API Wel1No.

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo.firaIr«Jearea cmie) 4>W7sw¾

600 17th St., Suite 1000N, Denver, CO 80202 303-824-5526 10.Fieldand Pool,or ExploratoryArea

4. Locationof Well (Footage,Sec..T. R.,M, or SurveyDescription) Natural Buttes/Wasatch/Mesaverde

1926' FSL & 2179' FEL (NW/SE)
11.CountyorParish, State

Sec. 4-T9S-R23E 40.063019 LAT 109.330389 LON Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NOrlICE, R iPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Pmducdon (Sart/Resume) Waw SlmtŒ
Noticeof Intent Alter Casing FractmeTreat Reclamation WelHngty

O SubsequentReport Casing Repaa New Construction Recomplete Other Commingling

ChangePlans Plug and Abandon TemporarilyAbandon application

O FinalAbandonment Notice Converno injection PlugBack WaterDisposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearly state all pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof.
If theproposalistodeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and tmevertical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.

Attach the Bond under which thework will beperfonnedor providethe BondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequent reports mustbe filedwithin 30days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. If theoperation resultsin a multiplecompletion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form3160-4must befiledonce

testinghas been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filedonly after all requirements, including reclamation, have beencompleted, and the operator has

determinedthatthesite isready forfinalinspection.)

EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization for commingling of production kom the Wasatch and Mesaverde formations in the referenced

wellbore. In the event allocation of production is necessary, the allocation will be based on proportionate net pay as calculated kom open hole

logs. Production kom the Wasatch and Mesaverde formations will be commingled in the wellbore and produced through open ended 2-3/8"
tubing landed below all perforations in the 4-l/2" production casing.

Attached is a map showing the location of all wells on contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units and an affidavit showing that this application

has been provided to owners of all cm us æ « drillingeunits o rlying th .

RECEIVED

14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Tvped)

Mary A. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant

Signature Date 04/16/20(V1

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditionsof approval,if any, are attached. Approvalof thisnotice doesnot warrant or

certify thattheapplicant holdslegalor equitable titleto those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212, make it a crime forany personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
States any false,fictitious or fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matterwithin its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page



STATEOFCOLORADO)

) ss

COUNTY OF DENVER )

VERIFICATION

Mary A. Maestas, of lawful age, being first duly sworn upon oath, deposes and
says:
She is a Regulatory Assistant of EOG Resources, Inc. EOG Resources, Inc. is the
operator of the following described well:

East Chapita 11-04
1926' FSL - 2179' FEL (NWSE)

SECTION 4, T9S, R23E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

EOG Resources, Inc. is the only owner in the well and/or of all contiguous
oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the pool.

On the 16 day of April, 2007 she placed in the United States mail, with postage
prepaid, a copy of the attached Application for Commingling in one wellbore for the
subject well.

Said envelope which contained these instruments was addressed to the Utah
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining, and Bureau of Land Management.

Further affiant saith not.

Mary . M estas
Regulatory Assistant

Subscribed and sworn before me this 16 day of April, 2007.

Wotaryublic
M
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Form3160-4 UNITED STATES(April101) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR FORM APPROVED

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT F pr s Mar h3 , )07

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. Lease Serial No.
U-01304

la. Type of Well Oil Well Gas Well DDry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. TypeofCompletion: GNewWell WorkOver ODeepen GPlugBack ODiff.Resvr,.

Other
2 Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

2. Name of Operator EOG Resources.Inc. 8. Lease Name and Well No.
East Chapita 11-04

3. Address 600 17th Street, Suite 1000N, Denver. CO 80202 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. AFI Well No.
303-824-5526 43-047-36825

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)* 10. Field and Pool.or Exploratory

Natural Buttes/Mesaverde
At surface 1926' FSL & 2179' FEL (NWSE) 40.063019 LAT 109330389 LON 11. Sec., T., R., M., on Block and

At top prod. interval reported below Same
Survey or Area Sec.4-T98-R23E

11 County or Parish \3. State

At total depth Same Uintah County UT

14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed 04/09/20&1 17. Elevations (DF,RKB, RT, GL)*

01/17/2007 02/27/2007 D & A Ready to Prod. 4973' NAT GL

18. Total Depth: MD 9400 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 9340 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD

TVD TVD TVD

21. Type Electric &Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22. Was well cored? No OYes (Submitanalysis)
Was DST run? / No Yes (Submit report)

Gamma Ray, Temp Log Directional Survey? / No es (Submit copy)

3. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#lft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD)
Stage Cehmenter No. of SC & Slu Vol Cement Top* Amount Pulled

12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36.0 J-55 0-2446 520 sx
7-7/8" 4-1/2" 11.6 N-80 0-9383 1710 sx

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set(MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)

2-3/8" 7795
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status

A) Mesaverde 7159 9208 9075-9208 3/spf

B) 8836-9030 2/spf

C) 8593-8784 2/spf

DI 8364-8549 2/spf
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment. Cement Squeeze,etc.

Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
9075-9208 49,473 GALS GELLED WATER & 112,600# 20/40 SAND
8836-9030 49,389 GALS GELLED WATER & 113,600#20/40 SAND
8593-8784 49.053 GALS GELLED WATER & 113,800#20/40 SAND
8364-8549 58303 GALS GELLED WATER & 140.700#20/40 SAND

28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas ProductionMethod
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Coir.API Gravity

64/09/2007 04/17/2007 24 40 227 2m FLows FROM wELL

Choke Tbg. Press. Css- 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
mm•• SI 1400 2775 Jo 227 240

PRODUCING GAS WELL

28a. Production - Interval B
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Producton BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/0il Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rale BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI * RECEIVED
*(Seeinstructions and spaces for additional data on page 2)

MAY03 2007
Div.OFOIL,GAS&



28b.Production- IntervalC
DateFirst Test Hours Test Oil lias Water Gil Gravity Gas ProductionMethod
Produced Date Tested Pnxiuction BBL MCF BBL Gr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg.Press. ('58 24Hr oil Gas Water Ga.s/0il Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production- IntervalD
DateFirst Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Gil Gravily Gas ProductionMethod
Produced Date Tested Producton BBL MCF BBL Gn API Gravity

Choke Tbg Press. Csg. 24Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/0il WellStatus
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

'9. Dispositionof Gas (Sold.usedforfuel,vented, etc.)

SOLD

30. Summaryof Porous Zones(includeAquifers): 31. Formationdog) Markers

Showall importantzones of porosityand contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, includingdepth interval tested,cushion used, time toolopen, flowingand shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions,Contents,etc. Name I°P
Meas.Depth

Mesaverde 7159 9208 Wasatch 4868
Chapita Wells 5471
Buck Canyon 6087
North Horn 6679
Mesaverde 7150
Middle Price River 7906
Lower Price River 8706
Sego 9252

32. Additional remarks (includepluggingprocedure):

SEE ATTACHED SHEET.

33. Indicate which itmeshavebeenattached by placinga check in theappropriate boxes:

0 Electrical/MechanicalLogs(1 fullset req'd.) O oeologicaerort 0 esrReport ODirectional Survey

O SundryNoticeforpluggingand cement verification O CoreAnalysis OOther

34. I hereby certify that the foregoingand attached informationiscomplete and correct as determinedfromall available records (see attached instructions)*

Name(please print) Mary A. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant

Signature Date 0542/2007

Title 18U.S.C Section 1001 and Title43 U.S.C Section1212, make it a crime forany personknowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
Statesany false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representationsas to any matterwithin its jurisdiction.

(Form3160-4,page



East Chapita 11-4 - ADDITIONAL REMARKS(CONTINUED):

26. PERFORATION RECORD
8129-8327 3/spf
7869-8080 2/spf
7492-7776 2/spf
7159-7393 2/spf

27. ACID, FRACTURE TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
8129-8327 58,671 GALS GELLED WATER & 143,600# 20/40 SAND
7869-8080 64,215 GALS GELLED WATER& 161,700# 20/40 SAND
7492-7776 59,217 GALS GELLED WATER & 145,600# 20/40 SAND
7159-7393 54,975 GALS GELLED WATER & 132,000# 20/40 SAND

Perforated the Lower Price River from 9075-9076', 9080-9081', 9094-9095', 9103-9104',
9128-9129', 9141-9142', 9151-9152', 9165-9166', 9172-9173', 9180-9181', 9201-9202' &
9207-9208' w/ 3 spf.

Perforated the Lower Price River from 8836-8837', 8846-8847', 8862-8864', 8876-8877',
8896-8897', 8902-8903', 8919-8920', 8949-8950', 8973-8974', 8994-8995', 9007-9008', 9012-

9013' & 9029-9030' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Middle/Lower Price River from 8593-8594', 8605-8606', 8629-8630', 8638-

8639', 8652-8653', 8657-8658', 8671-8672', 8679-8680', 8693-8694', 8749-8750', 8759-8760',
8768-8769', 8778-8779' & 8783-8784' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 8364-8367', 8375-8376', 8398-8399', 8404-8405',
8412-8413', 8432-8433', 8449-8451', 8481-8482', 8487-8488', 8522-8523' &8548-8549' w/ 2
spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 8129-8130', 8136-8137', 8155-8156', 8230-8231',
8241-8242', 8247-8248', 8272-8273', 8282-8283', 8291-8292', 8308-8309', 8317-8318' &
8326-8327' w/ 3 spf.

Perforated the Middle/Upper Price River from 7869-7870', 7894-7895', 7920-7921', 7931-

7932', 7947-7948', 7964-7965', 7982-7983', 7995-7996', 8010-8011', 8027-8028', 8037-8038',
8045-8046', 8074-8075' & 8079-8080' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7492-7493', 7515-7516', 7533-7534', 7541-7542',
7579-7580', 7587-7588', 7651-7652', 7689-7690', 7740-7741', 7747-7748', 7752-7753', 7768-

7769' & 7775-7776' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7159-7160', 7167-7168', 7173-7174', 7196-7197',
7217-7218', 7264-7265', 7286-7287', 7304-7305', 7321-7322', 7331-7332', 7347-7348', 7355-

7356', 7377-7378' &7392-7393' w/ 2



STATE OF UTAH FORM 7
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

REPORT OF WATER ENCOUNTERED DURING DRILLING

Well name and number: ECW 11-4

API number:

Well Location: QQ NWSE Section 4 Township 9S Range 23E County UINTAH

Well operator: EOG

Address: 1060 E HWY40

city VERNAL state UT zip 874078 Phone: (435) 781-9111

Drillingcontractor: BILL JR RATHOLE DRILLING

Address: 384 E 2500 S

city VERNAL state UT ¿¡p 84078 Phone: (435) 789-4729

Water encountered (attach additional pages as needed):

DEPTH VOLUME QUALITY

FROM TO (FLOW RATE OR HEAD) (FRESH OR SALTY)

1,620 1,640 NO FLOW NOT KNOWN

Formation tops: 1 2 3
(Top to Bottom)

4 5 6

7 8 9

10 11 12

If an analysis has been made of the water encountered, please attach a copy of the report to this form.

I hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT)
Mary A. Maestas TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
5/2/2007



IP date corrected from a previous submission dated 4/20/2007.

Fonn 31(A5 UNITED STATES EURMAPPROVED
(Februarj2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR y co;

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U 13 4

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian.Allotteeor TribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unitor CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of
Jil Well GasWell Other

8. Well Nameand Na
EAST CIIAPITA 11-4

2. NameofOperator EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API Well No.
3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36825

600 17th St., Suite 1000N. Denver, CO 80202 303-824-5526 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T. R., M., or Swny Description) Natural Buttes/Mesaverde

1926' FSL & 2179' FEL (NWISE) 11. Countyor Parish, State
Sec.4-T9S-R23E 40.063019 LAT 109.330389 LON Uintah County.Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NGTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Of
O Notice of Intent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation WenIntegnty

SubsequentRepon Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Oder
O ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporarilyAbandonO FinalAbandonmentNotice Convento Injection PlugBack Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or CompletedOperation(clearly state all pertinentdetails,including estimated starting dateof any proposed work and approximate durationthereof.
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinent markera and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will beperformedor provide the Bond No. on filewith BLM/BIA.Required subsequent reports must befiledwithin 30days
following completion of theinvolvedoperations. If the opemtion results ina multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval,a Form3160-4must befiledonce
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only aner all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

The referenced well was turned to sales on 4/3/2007.

14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name /Printed/Tvped)

Mary A. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant

Signatne Date 08/01/2007

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice doesnot warrant or
certify that the applicant holdslegalor equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212, make it a crime forany person knowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page 2) RECEIVED

AUSO62007
DIVOFOlL,GAS&



I.P date corrected from a previous submission dated 5/2/2007.

Form3160-4 IJNITED STATES(April 301) I)EPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR FORM APPROVED

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT lx'prs arch3 07
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORTANDLOG 5. LeaseSerialNo.

U-01304

la. Type of Well 00il Well Gas Well Dry COther 6. If Indian. Allottee or tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: New Well Work Over CDeepen GPlug Back O Diff. Resvr, .

Other 7 Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

2. Name of Uperator EOG Resources, Inc. 8. Lease Name and Well No.
East Chapita 11-04

3. Address 600 17th Street. Suite 1(MM)N,Denver. CO 80202 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. AEl Well No.
303-824-5526 43-047-36825

4. Location of Well (Report location clear/vand in accordamce wah Federal requirements)* 0. Eieldand Pool.or Exploratory
Natural Buttes/Mesaverde

At surface 1926' FSL & 2179' FEL (NWSE) 40.063019 LAT 109.330389 LON
I 1. Sec., T., R., M.. on Block and

At top prod. interval reported below Same Survey or Area Sec. 4-T9S-R23E

11 County or Pansh 13. State
At total depth Same Uintah County UT

14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed 04/03/2007 17. Elevations (DF. RKB. RT,GL)*

01/17/2007 02/27/2007 D & A Ready to Prod. 4973' NAT GL

18. Total Depth: MD 9400 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 9340 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD

TVD TVD TVD

21. Type Electric &Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22. Was well cored? No OYes (Submit analysis)
Was DST run? ,f No Yes (Submit report)

Gamma Ray, Temp Log Directional Survey? No Des (Submit copy)

3. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

HoleSize Size/Grade Wt.(#lft.) Top(MD) BottomtMD)
StageCehmenter

.of Sk & SluËL) CementTop* AmountPulled

12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36.0 .!-55 0-2446 520 sx
7-7/8" 4-1/2" 11.6 N-80 0-9383 1710 sx

24. Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)

2-3/8" 7795
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A) Mesaverde 7159 9208 9075-9208 3/spf
B) 8836-9030 2/spf
C) 8593-8784 2/spf
D) 8364-8549 2/spf
27. Acid, Fracture. Treatment. Cement Squeeze. etc.

Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
9075-9208 49.473 GALS GELLED WATER & 112.600#20/40 SAND
8836-9030 49389 GALS GELLED WATER & 113.600#20/40 SAND
8593-8784 49.053 GALS GELLED WATER & 113.800#20/40 SAND
8364-8549 58303 GALS GELLED WATER & 140.700#20/40 SAND

28. Production - Interval A
Date Firs! Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Coir. API Gravity

04/03/2tN)7 04/17/21NI7 24 40 227 240 FLOWS FROM WELL

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg- '4 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas/0il Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

10/64" SI 1400 2775 40 227 240
PRODUCING GAS WELL

28a. Production - Interval B
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Producton BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravity

Choke Tbg.Press. Csg. 24Hr Oil Gas Water Gas,0il Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI
*tSee instructions and spaces ¡or additional data on page 2) RECEIVED

AUSO62007

DN.0FOIL,GAS&



28b.Production- IntervalC
D.ite Firs! Test Hours Test Oil (iiis W:tter Gil tiraitv illis Production Method
Prothtced Ditte Tested Production BBL Mt F BßL Coir.API Gravity

(hoke Tbg.Press. Csg. 2 Hr Gil Gits Water this/Dil WellSittlus
Size Flwg. Press- R te BBL MCF BBL R;tlio

28c. Production- IntervalD
D:iteFirst Test Hours Test Gil Gas W;iter Gil Gravilv Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Producton BBL MCF BBL CorrAPI Gravity

( linke Tbg.Press. ('sg. 24Hr Oil Gas Water (its/Oil WellStatus
Site F1wg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

3). Dispositionof Gas(Sold, usedforfuel,vented. etc.)

SOLD

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation ilm) Markers

Showall importantzones of porosityand contents thereof: Coredintervalsand all drill-stem
tests. includingdepthintervaltested.eushion used, time toolopen. flowingand shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents,etc. Name
Meas. Depth

Mesaverde 7159 9208 Wasatch 4868
Chapita WeHs 5471
Buck Canyon 6087
North Horn 6679
Mesaverde 7150
Middle Price River 7906
Lower Price River 8706
Sego 9252

31 Additional remarks (includepluggingprocedure):

SEE ATTACHED SHEET.

33. Indicate which itmeshave been attached by placinga check in the appropriate boxes:

0 Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 fullset req'd.) O GeologicReport ODSTReport ODirectional Survey

O SundryNoticeforpluggingand cement verification 0 CoreAnalysis DOther:

34. I hereby cenify that the foregoingand attached informationiscomplete and correct as deternined fromall available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) Mary A. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant

Signatu Date 08/01/2007

Tille 18U.SC Section 1001 and Title43 U.S.C Section1212, make it a crime for any person knowinely and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
Statesany false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matterwithin its junsdiction.

(Form3160-4.page



East Chapita 11-4 - ADDITIONAL REMARKS(CONTINUED):

26. PERFORATION RECORD
8129-8327 3/spf
7869-8080 2/spf
7492-7776 2/spf
7159-7393 2/spf

27. ACID, FRACTURE TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
8129-8327 58,671 GALS GELLED WATER & 143,600# 20/40 SAND
7869-8080 64,215 GALS GELLED WATER & 161,700# 20/40 SAND
7492-7776 59,217 GALS GELLED WATER & 145,600# 20/40 SAND
7159-7393 54,975 GALS GELLED WATER & 132,000# 20/40 SAND

Perforated the Lower Price River from 9075-9076', 9080-9081', 9094-9095', 9103-9104',
9128-9129', 9141-9142', 9151-9152', 9165-9166', 9172-9173', 9180-9181', 9201-9202' &
9207-9208' w/ 3 spf.

Perforated the Lower Price River from 8836-8837', 8846-8847', 8862-8864', 8876-8877',
8896-8897', 8902-8903', 8919-8920', 8949-8950', 8973-8974', 8994-8995', 9007-9008', 9012-
9013' & 9029-9030' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Middle/Lower Price River from 8593-8594', 8605-8606', 8629-8630', 8638-
8639', 8652-8653', 8657-8658', 8671-8672', 8679-8680', 8693-8694', 8749-8750', 8759-8760',
8768-8769', 8778-8779' & 8783-8784' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 8364-8367', 8375-8376', 8398-8399', 8404-8405',
8412-8413', 8432-8433', 8449-8451', 8481-8482', 8487-8488', 8522-8523' & 8548-8549' w/ 2
spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 8129-8130', 8136-8137', 8155-8156', 8230-8231',
8241-8242', 8247-8248', 8272-8273', 8282-8283', 8291-8292', 8308-8309', 8317-8318' &
8326-8327' w/ 3 spf.

Perforated the Middle/Upper Price River from 7869-7870', 7894-7895', 7920-7921', 7931-
7932', 7947-7948', 7964-7965', 7982-7983', 7995-7996', 8010-8011', 8027-8028', 8037-8038',
8045-8046', 8074-8075' & 8079-8080' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7492-7493', 7515-7516', 7533-7534', 7541-7542',
7579-7580', 7587-7588', 7651-7652', 7689-7690', 7740-7741', 7747-7748', 7752-7753', 7768-
7769' & 7775-7776' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7159-7160', 7167-7168', 7173-7174', 7196-7197',
7217-7218', 7264-7265', 7286-7287', 7304-7305', 7321-7322', 7331-7332', 7347-7348', 7355-

7356', 7377-7378' & 7392-7393' w/ 2



3¼200057) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: July 31, 2010
5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTUO1304
Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an

abandoned we/I. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

l. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.
O Oil Well @ Gas Well O Other EAST CHAPITA 11-04

2. Name of Operator Contact: MARYA. MAESTAS 9. API Well No.
EOG RESOURCES INC E-Mail: mary maestas@eogresources.com 43-047-36825

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
600 17TH STREET SUITE 1000N Ph: 303-824-5526 NATURALBUTTES/WASATCH/MV
DENVER, CO 80202

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Pansh, and State

Sec 4 T9S R23E NWSE 1926FSL 2179FEL UINTAHCOUNTY, UT
40.06302 N Lat, 109.33039 W Lon

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent 0 Acidize O Deepen 0 Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off

0 Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity
B Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction g Recomplete O Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon

0 Convert to Injection 0 Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation(clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthat the site is ready for final inspection.)

EOG Resources, Inc. recompleted the following well in the Wasatch formation as per the attached
sheet.

Commingling approval was given in May 2007.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #59104 verifie by the BLM Well Information System

For EOG RESOURCES NC, sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Typed) MARY A. MAESTAS Title REGULATORYASSISTANT

Signat lectro cS ) Date 03/14/2008

THIS SP'ACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved By_
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMI EGEIVED
MAR17 2008

DIV.OFOlL.GAS&



East Chapita 11-4- ADDITIONALREMARKS

Perforated the North Horn from 6917-19', 6950-51', 6958-59', 6996-97', 7011-12', 7022-23',
7030-31', 7047-48', 7077-78', 7090-92' & 7130-32' w/ 2 spf. Fracture stimulated with 56,178
gals gelled water and 143,600# 20/40 sand.

Perforated the North Horn from 6692-93', 6715-16', 6732-33', 6739-40', 6749-50', 6756-57',
6769-70', 6773-74', 6809-10', 6821-22', 6847-48', 6854-55' & 6870-71' w/ 2 spf. Fracture
stimulated with 45,180 gals gelled water and 113,500# 20/40 sand.

Perforated the Bf from 6314-15', 6324-25', 6340-41', 6353-54', 6364-65', 6390-91', 6398-99',
6438-39', 6474-75', 6493-94', 6509-10', 6526-27', 6559-60' & 6590-91' w/ 2 spf. Fracture
stimulated with 42,541 gals gelled water and 108,600# 20/40 sand.

Perforated the Ba from 6027-28', 6033-34', 6046-47', 6068-69', 6090-91', 6105-06', 6159-60',
6176-77', 6217-18', 6238-39' & 6252-54' w/ 3 spf. Fracture stimulated with 42,867 gals gelled
water and 109,300# 20/40 sand.

Perforated the Ca from 5513-15', 5536-37', 5543-46', 5556-59' &5569-72' w/ 3 spf. Fracture
stimulated with 23,600 gals gelled water and 55,600# 20/40 sand.

Perforated the Ca from 5435-5443' w/ 3 spf. Fracture stimulated with 17,675 gals gelled
water and 37,300# 20/40 sand.

Returned well to sales on 3/12/2008, commingling the Wasatch and Mesaverde



3st200057) UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: July 31, 2010
5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTUO1304
Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

O Oil Well Gas Well O Other EAST CHAPITA 11-04

2. Name of Operator Contact: MARYA. MAESTAS 9. API Well No.
EOG RESOURCES INC E-Mail:mary_maestas@eogresources.com 43-047-36825

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
600 17TH STREET SUITE 1000N Ph: 303-824-5526 NATURALBUTTES/WASATCH/MV
DENVER, CO 80202

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 4 T9S R23E NWSE 1926FSL 2179FEL UINTAHCOUNTY, UT
40.06302 N Lat, 109.33039 W Lon

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize O Deepen 0 Production (Start/Resume) 0 Water Shut-Off
Notice of Intent

0 Alter Casing 0 Fracture Treat 0 Reclamation O Well Integrity
0 Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete B Other

0 Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon

0 Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or CompletedOperation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deependirectionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testinghas been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization to use a low-profileevaporation unit in the reserve pit
for the referenced location.

Accented by the

Utah
Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR
RECORDONLY

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #61004 verifie- by the BLMWell Information System

For EOG RESOURCES NC, sent to the Vernal

Name(Printed/Typed) MARYA. MAESTAS Title REGULATORYASSISTANT

Signat et iq Submi i Date 06/19/2008

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved By_
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any personknowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED ** OPERATOR-SUBMITTED **

JUN1 3 2003

DN.0FO\L,GAS&
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