
PERilITC0

14421 County Rd. 10 • Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621 • (303) 857-9999 • FAX (303) 857-0577 • E-MAIL Permitco l@aol.com

May19,2005

DivisionofOil,Gas&Mining
1594West NorthTemple,Suite1210
Box145801
SaltLakeCity,UT 84114-5801

Re: GascoProduction Company
SheepWash Federal#23-25-9-18
2052'FSLand 1932'FWL
NESWSection25,T95- RT8E
UintahCounty,Utah
Lease No.U-9803

Gentlemen:

Enclosedpleasefind two copiesof the Applicationfor Permit to Drill,alongwithonecopyof the
OnshoreOrderNo;1 whichwasfiledwiththeBLMInVernal,Utah.

Ifyoushouldneedadditionalinformation,pleasedon't hesitate tocontabtme. Approvedcopiesofthe
A.P.D.shoultbe sentto Permitco Inc.at theaddressshownabove.

Sincerely,

Venessa Langmacher
Consultantfor
GascoProduction Company

Enc.
RECEIVED

cc: GascoProduction Company- Englewood,CO
MAY23 2005

ShawnElworthy- Roosevelt,UT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

PERilITC0

14421 County Rd. 10 • Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621 • (303) 857-9999 • FAX (303) 857-0577 • E-MAIL Permitco l@aol.com

May19,2005

DivisionofOil,Gas&Mining
1594West NorthTemple,Suite1210
Box145801
SaltLakeCity,UT 84114-5801

Re: GascoProduction Company
SheepWash Federal#23-25-9-18
2052'FSLand 1932'FWL
NESWSection25,T95- RT8E
UintahCounty,Utah
Lease No.U-9803

Gentlemen:

Enclosedpleasefind two copiesof the Applicationfor Permit to Drill,alongwithonecopyof the
OnshoreOrderNo;1 whichwasfiledwiththeBLMInVernal,Utah.

Ifyoushouldneedadditionalinformation,pleasedon't hesitate tocontabtme. Approvedcopiesofthe
A.P.D.shoultbe sentto Permitco Inc.at theaddressshownabove.

Sincerely,

Venessa Langmacher
Consultantfor
GascoProduction Company

Enc.
RECEIVED

cc: GascoProduction Company- Englewood,CO
MAY23 2005

ShawnElworthy- Roosevelt,UT DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

AMENDED REPORT
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING (highlight changes)

. HH I
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

UMINERA3LLEASENO.: 6. SURFACE:

1A TYPE OF WORK: DRILLË REENTER O DEEPEN O 7 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

N/A
B TYPE OF WELL: OILO GAS00 OTHER SINGLEZONEO MULTIPLEZONE O 8 UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9 WELL NAME and NUMBER:

GascoProductionCompany Sheep Wash Federal #23-25-9-18
3. ADDR

in S re East, Suite100,Englewood,CO80112
PHO3NE B3ERO44 10 OO R LDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11.
MER

N:R,SECTION OWNSHIP, RANGE

AT SURFACE: 2052' FSLand 1932'FWL ffy2 2 214 Sec. 25,T9S-R18E

AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE NESW Ifo. oc o Z79

14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

Approximately24.6milesSoutheastofMyton,UT Uintah Utah
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16: NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

1932' 1400.1 40 Acres; NESW
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET):

Approx.1050' 12,891' UT-1233
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTlMATED DURATION:

4879' GL ASAP 35 Days

24. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT

17-1/2" 13-3/8", H40,48# 170' 225sx PremiumType5, 15.6ppg,1.18yield
12-1/4" 8-5/8",J-55,32# 3,318' 546sx Hi-Lift,11ppg,3.91yield&185sx 10-2RFC,14.2ppg,1.63yield
7-7/8" 4-1/2",P110,13.5# 12,891' 1717sx Hi-Lift,11.5ppg, 3.05yield &366sx 50-50Poz, 14.1ppg, 1.28yield

COMPENWL-T!GHTHOLE

25. ATTACHMENTS
VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLING PROGRAM[¯]
EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

AGENT: PermitCoInc. AGENT'SPHONENO.: 303-857-9999

NAME (PLEASEP T) V9nOSs Langmacher TITLE Agent ÍOf OSSCO Production Company

SIGNATURE DATE May19,2005

(This space for State use only)

API NUMBER ASSIGNED: APPROVAL: RECEIVED
Approvedby the ] MAY23 2005Utah Division of

e instructions on Reverse
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RR GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY -

T9S RiBE S.L.B.&M. ja 79' ' Well location, SHEEP WASH FEDERALE ENB9'42'48"W - 2641.24' (Meas.) NB9°46'40"W
- 2640.66' (Meas.) #23-25-9-18, located as shown in the NE 1/4

1910 gross Cop, 1910 Brass Cap, Brass Cap, " SW 1/4 of Section 25, T9S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.
2 O' High, Pile 0. 7' High, Stones 1.5' High, Pile Uint a h Count y, Ut a h .of Stones, Steel of Stones
Post

BASIS OF ELEVATION
SPOT ELEVATIONLOCATED AT THE NORTHWESTCORNER OF
SECTION 31, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE MOON
BOTTOM, QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE
QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY.
SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 4838 FEET.

1910 Brass Cap, 1910 Brass Cap,
1.1' High, Steel 0.6' High, P//e NPost of Stones

/2HE 25/‡'A9SHŒFEDERAL

E/ev. Ungraded Ground = 4879'
SCALE

CERTIFICATEI
L THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM

FlELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND CORRECTTO THEj
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BELIEF I

1910 Brass Cop, Set Marked Stone, Brass Cop, REGISTEREDLAND SURVEYOR0.6' High, Pile 1.5' High, Pile of 2.J' High, Pile REGISTRATIONNO. 161319of Stones Stones of Stones STATE OF UTARNB9°41'27 "W - 2642. 95' (Meas.) S89°J9'49 T - 2641.94' (Meas.)

UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINGBASIS OF BEARINGS
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

(435) 789-1017
LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUSNAD 83) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:LATITUDE= 40 00'01.07" (40.000297) 1" = 1000' 04---08-05 04--27-05

=
90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109'50'40.35" (109.844542) PARTY REFERENCES(AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) S.H. L.M P.M G.L.O. PLAT= PROPOSED WELL HEAD· LATITUDE= 40 00'01.20" (40.000333)

A = SECTION CORNERSLOCATED. LONGITUDE=
109°50'37.83" (109.843842)

OOL ASCO PRODUCTION
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CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1

ApprovalofOperationson Onshore
Federaland IndianOil&GasLeases

Sheep Wash Federal#23-25-9-18
2052'FSLand 1932'FWL

NESWSection25, T9S-R18E
UintahCounty,Utah

Prepared For:

GascoProduction Company

By:

PERMITC0INC.
14421CountyRoad 10

Ft. Lupton,Colorado80621 ,

303/857-9999

CopiesSentTo:

- Bureau ofLand Management- Vernal,UT 4 me
UtahDivisionofOil,Gas&Mining- SLC,UT g 4

2 - GascoProduction Company- Englewood,CO g e

1 - ShawnElworthy- Roosevelt, UT y
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APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRI DRREENTER

24. Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Attached.

2. A Drilling Plan
Attached.

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the SUPO shall be filed with the Appropriate Forest
Service Office.

SeeSurface Use Plan Anached.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see Item 20).
Bond coveragefor thiswellis providedby GascoProduction Company undertheirBLMBond No.UT-1233.

5. Operator certification.
Please be advisedthat Gasco Production Company is consideredto be the operatorof the abovementionedwell.
Gasco ProductionCompanyagrees to be responsible under the termsand conditionsofthe lease for the operations
conducted upon the leased lands.

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the authorized
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ONSHOREORDERNO.1 e GNFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GascoProductionCompany
Sheep Wash Federal#23-25-9-18 Lease No.U-9803
2052' FSLand1932'FWL
NESWSection25,T9S-R18E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page i

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1
ApprovalofOperationson Onshore

Federal and IndianOiland Gas Leases

Allleaseand/orunitoperationswillbeconductedinsucha mannerthatfullcomplianceismadewithapplicable
laws,regulations(43CFR3100), OnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,andtheapprovedplanofoperations.The
operatorisfullyresponsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe furnished
thefieldrepresentativetoinsurecompliance.

1. ESTIMATEDTOPSOFIMPORTANTGEOLOGICMARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea

Uinta Surface +4,877'

Wasatch 5,271' -380'

Mesaverde 9,111' -4,220'

Castlegate 11,641' -6,750'

Blackhawk 11,951' -7,060'

SpringCanyon 12,591' -7,700'

T.D. 12,891 -8,000'

2. ESTIMATEDDEPTHOFANTICIPATEDWATER,OIL,GASORMINERALFORMATIONS:

Substance Formation Depth

Gas Wasatch 6,000'-9,111'

Gas Medaverde 9,111'-11,641'

Gas Blackhawk 11,951'-12,800'

Allfreshwaterprospectivelyvaluablemineralsencounteredduringdrilling,willbe recorded
by depth and adequatelyprotected. Alloiland gas showswillbe testedto determine
commercialpotential.

PER
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. ONSHOREORDERNO.1 JNFIDENTIAL - TIGHTHOLE
GascoProductionCompany
SheepWash Federal#23-25-9-18 Lease No.U-9803
2052'FSLand1932'FWL
NESWSection25, T9S-R18E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 2

3. PRESSURECONTROLEQUIPMENT

GascoProductionCompany'sminimumspecificationsforpressurecontrolequipmentareas follows:

RamType: 11"Hydraulicdoublewithannular,5000psiw.p.

Ramtypepreventersandassociatedequipmentshallbe testedtoapprovedstackworkingpressure
if isolatedby test plug or to 70 percent of internalyieldpressure of casing. Pressure shallbe
maintainedforat least 10minutesor untilrequirementsoftestaremet,whicheveris longer. Ifa test
plugis utilized,nobleed-offpressureisacceptable.Fora testnotutilizinga testplug,ifa declinein
pressureofmorethan10percentin30 minutesoccurs,thetestshallbe consideredtohavefailed.
Valveoncasinghead belowtestplugshallbe openduringtestofBOPstack.

Annulartypepreventers(ifused)shallbe testedto50 percentofratedworkingpressure. Pressure
shallbe maintainedat least 10minutesoruntilprovisionsoftestare met,whicheveris longer.

Asa minimum,theabovetestshallbe performed:

a. wheninitiallyinstalled;
b. wheneveranysealsubjecttotestpressureis broken
c. followingrelatedrepairs;and
d. at 30-dayintervals

Valvesshallbe testedfromworkingpressuresideduringBOPEtestswithalldownstreamvalves
open.

Whentestingthekilllinevalve(s)thecheckvalveshallbe heldopenortheballremoved.

Annularpreventersshallbe functionallyoperatedat leastweekly.

Pipeandblindramsshallbe activatedeachtrip,however,thisfunctionneednotbe performedmore
thanoncea day.

ABOPEpitleveldrillshallbe conductedweeklyforeachdrillingcrew.

Pressuretestsshallapplytoallrelatedwellcontrolequipment.

Alloftheabovedescribedtestsand/ordrillsshallbe recordedinthedrillinglog.

PEIL
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2052'FSLand1932'FWL
NESWSection25,T9S-R18E DRILLINGPROGRAM
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B0P systemsshallbe consistentwithAPIRP53. Pressuretestswillbe conductedbeforedrillingout
fromundercasingstringswhichhave been setandcementedinplace. Blowoutpreventercontrols
willbe installedpriortodrillingthesurfacecasingplugandwillremaininuse untilthewelliscompleted
orabandoned.Preventerswillbe inspectedandoperatedat leastdailytoensuregoodmechanical
workingorder,andthisinspectionwillbe recordedon thedailydrillingreport. Preventerswillbe
pressuretestedbeforedrillingcasingcementplugs.

TheDistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientleadtime,inordertohavetheBLMrepresentative
on locationduringpressuretesting.

a. ThesizeandratingoftheBOPstackisshownontheattacheddiagram.Althougha righas
notbeen chosentodrillthiswell,mostoftheequipmentforthisdepthdf holeintheareause
a 11",5000psiworkingpressureblowoutpreventor,

b. Achokelineanda killlinearetobe properlyinstalled.The killlineis .rg tobe usedas a
fill-upline.

c. Theaccumulatorsystemshallhavea pressurecapacitytoprovideforrepeatedoperationof
hydraulicpreventers.

d. Drillstringsafetyvalve(s),tofitall_toolsinthedrillstring,aretobe maintainedontherigfloor
whiledrillingoperationsare inprogress.

4. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM:

a. The proposedcasingandcementingprogramshallbe conductedas approvedtoprotect
and/orisolateallusablewaterzones,potentiallyproductivezones, lostcirculationzones,
abnormallypressuredzones, and anyprospectivelyvaluabledeposits of minerals.Any
isolatingmediumotherthancementshallreceiveapprovalpriortouse. Thecasingsetting
depthshallbe calculatedtopositionthecasingseatoppositea competentformationwhich
willcontain the maximumpressure to which it willbe exposedduring normal drilling
operations.Determinationofcasingsettingdepth shallbe based on allrelevantfactors,
including;presencelabsence of hydrocarbons;fracture gradients; usable water zones;
formationpressures;lostcirculationzones;otherminerals;orotherunusualcharacteristics.
Allindicationsof usablewatershallbe reported.
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pressuretestedbeforedrillingcasingcementplugs.

TheDistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientleadtime,inordertohavetheBLMrepresentative
on locationduringpressuretesting.

a. ThesizeandratingoftheBOPstackisshownontheattacheddiagram.Althougha righas
notbeen chosentodrillthiswell,mostoftheequipmentforthisdepthdf holeintheareause
a 11",5000psiworkingpressureblowoutpreventor,

b. Achokelineanda killlinearetobe properlyinstalled.The killlineis .rg tobe usedas a
fill-upline.

c. Theaccumulatorsystemshallhavea pressurecapacitytoprovideforrepeatedoperationof
hydraulicpreventers.

d. Drillstringsafetyvalve(s),tofitall_toolsinthedrillstring,aretobe maintainedontherigfloor
whiledrillingoperationsare inprogress.

4. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM:

a. The proposedcasingandcementingprogramshallbe conductedas approvedtoprotect
and/orisolateallusablewaterzones,potentiallyproductivezones, lostcirculationzones,
abnormallypressuredzones, and anyprospectivelyvaluabledeposits of minerals.Any
isolatingmediumotherthancementshallreceiveapprovalpriortouse. Thecasingsetting
depthshallbe calculatedtopositionthecasingseatoppositea competentformationwhich
willcontain the maximumpressure to which it willbe exposedduring normal drilling
operations.Determinationofcasingsettingdepth shallbe based on allrelevantfactors,
including;presencelabsence of hydrocarbons;fracture gradients; usable water zones;
formationpressures;lostcirculationzones;otherminerals;orotherunusualcharacteristics.
Allindicationsof usablewatershallbe reported.
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b. Casingdesignshallassumeformationpressuregradientsof0.44 to0.50 psiperfoot for
exploratorywells(lackingbetterdata).

c. Casingdesignshallassumefracturegradientsfrom0.70to1.00psiperfootforexploratory
wells(lackingbetterdata)

d. Casingcollarsshallhavea minimumclearanceof0.422inches ofallsides inthehole/casing
annulus,withrecognitionthatvariancescanbe grantedforjustifiedexceptions.

e. Allwaitingoncementtimesshallbe adequatetoachievea minimumof500psicompressive
strengthat thecasingshoepriortodrillingout.

f. Allcasingexcepttheconductorcasing,shallbe neworreconditionedandtestedusedcasing
thatmeetsorexceedsAPIstandardsfornewcasing.

g. Thesurfacecasingshallbe cementedbacktosurfaceeitherduringtheprimarycementjob
orbyremedialcementing.

h. Allindicationsofusablewatershallbe reportedtotheauthorizedofficerpriortorunningthe
nextstringofcasingor beforepluggingordersare requested,whicheveroccursfirst.

i. Threecentralizerswillbe runonthebottomthreejointsofsurfacecasingwitha minimumof
onecentralizerperjointstartingwiththeshoejoint.

j. Topplugsshallbe used toreducecontaminationofcementbydisplacementfluid.Abottom
plugorotheracceptabletechnique,suchas a suitablepreflushfluid,innerstringcement
method,etc.shallbe utilizedtohelpisolatethecementfromcontaminationbythemudfluid
beingdisplacedaheadofthecementslurry.

k. Allcasingstringsbelowtheconductorshallbe pressuretestedto0.22psiperfootofcasing
stringlengthor1500psi,whicheverisgreater,but nottoexceed70 percentoftheminimum
internalyield.Ifpressuredeclinesmorethan10percentin30minutes,correctiveactionshall
be taken.

l. Onallexploratorywells,andonthatportionofanywellapprovedfora 5MBOPEsystemor
greater,a pressure integritytestofeachcasingshoeshallbe performed.Formationat the
shoeshallbe testedtoa minimumofthemudweightequivalentanticipatedtocontrolthe
formationpressuretothenextcasingdepthorat totaldepthofthewell. Thistestshallbe
performedbeforedrillingmorethan20 feet ofnewhole. ¢ re
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m. Theproposedcasingprogramwillbe as follows:

Purpose Depth HoleSize 0.D. Weight Grade Type New/Used

Conductor 0-170' 17-1/2" 13-3/8" 48# H-40 - - - New

Surface 0-3,318' 12-1/4" 8-5/8" 32# J-55 ST&C New

Production 0-12,891' 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 LT&C New

n. Casingdesignsubjectto revisionbased ongeologicconditionsencountered.

o. Thecementprogramwillbe as follows:

Conductor TypeandAmount

O'- 170' 225sx PremiumType5 @15.6ppg,1.18cuft/skyield

Surface TypeandAmount

TOC@Surface Lead:546sxHi-Lift@11 ppg,3.91cuft/sk yield
Tail:185sx 10-2RFC@14.2ppg,1.63cuft/skyield

Production TypeandAmount

TOC@2,500' Lead:1717 sxHi-Lift@11.5ppg,3.05cuft/skyield
Tail:366sx50:50Poz @14.1ppg,1.28cuft/skyield

p. Anticipatedcementtopswillbe reportedas todepth;nottheexpectednumberofsacksof
cementtobe used. The DistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientleadtime,inorder
tohavea BLMrepresentativeon locationwhilerunningallcasingstringsandcementing.

q. Aftercementingbutbeforecommencinganytest,thecasingstringshallstandcementeduntil
thecementhas reacheda compressivestrengthofat least500psiat theshoe. WOCtime
shallbe recordedinthedriller'slog.

r. Thefollowingreportsshallbe filedwiththeDistrictManagerwithin30 daysaftertheworkis
completed.

PER IITC0
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1. Progress reports,Form3160-5(formerly9-331)"SundryNoticesand Reportson
Wells",mustincludecompleteinformationconcerning:

a. Settingofeachstringofcasing,showingthesize,grade,weightofcasing
set, holesize,settingdepth,amountsand typeofcementused, whether
cementcirculatedor thetopof the cementbehindthe casing,depth of
cementingtoolsused,casingtestmethodandresults,andthedate work
was done. Showthespud date onthefirstreportssubmitted.

b. Temperatureorbondlogsmustbesubmittedforeachwellwherethecasing
cementwasnotcirculatedtothesurface.

s. Auxiliaryequipmenttobe used is as follows:

1. Kellycock
2. Nobitfloatis deemednecessary.
3. Asubwitha fullopeningvalve.

5. MUDPROGRAM

a. The proposedcirculatingmediumstobe employedindrillingareas follows:

Interval MudType MudWt. Visc. F/L PH

O'- 170' FreshWater 8.33 1 - - - 7

170' - 3,318' FreshWater 8.33 1 - - - 7-8

3,318' - 12,891' FreshWater&DAP 9.0-11.5 30-40 12-20 8

Therewillbe sufficientmudon locationtocontrola blowoutshouldoneoccur.
Amudtestshallbe performedevery24 hoursaftermuddinguptodetermine,as applicable:
density,viscosity,gelstrength,staticfiltrationloss,andPh.

b. Mudmonitoringequipmenttobe used isas follows:

1. Periodiccheckswillbe madeeachtourofthemudsystem.The mudlevelwillbe
checkedvisually.
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c. Nochromateadditiveswillbe used inthemudsystemonFederaland/orIndianlandswithout
priorBLMapprovaltoensureadequateprotectionoffreshwateraquifers.

d. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitleIllinanamountequaltoorgreaterthan
10,000poundswillbe used,produced, stored,transported,or disposed of annuallyin
associationwiththedrillingofthiswell. Furthermore,no extremelyhazardoussubstances,
as definedin40 CFR355, inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used, produced,stored,
transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

e. The use ofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformto43 CFR3610.2-3.

6. EVALUATIONPROGRAM

The anticipatedtypeandamountoftesting,loggingandcoringareas follows:

a. Nodrillstemtestsareanticipated,however,ifDST'sarerun,thefollowingrequirementswill
be adheredto:

Initialopeningof drillstemtesttoolsshallbe restrictedtodaylighthours unlessspecific
approvaltostartduringotherhoursisobtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.However,DST's
maybe allowedtocontinueatnightifthetestwas initiatedduringdaylighthoursandtherate
offlowis stabilizedand ifadequatelightingis available(i.e.lightingwhichis adequatefor
visibilityandvapor-proofforsafeoperations).Packerscanbe released,buttrippingshallnot
beginbeforedaylight,unlesspriorapprovalis obtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.Closed
chamberDSTsmaybe accomplisheddayornight.

ADSTthatflowstothesurfacewithevidenceofhydrocarbonsshallbe eitherreversedout
ofthetestingstringundercontrolledsurfaceconditions.Thiswouldinvolveprovidedsome
meansforreversecirculation.

Separationequipmentrequiredfortheanticipatedrecoveryshallbe properlyinstalledbefore
a teststarts.

Allengineswithin100 feetofthewellborethatarerequiredto"run"duringthetestshallhave
sparkarrestersorwatercooledexhausts.

b. Theloggingprogramwillconsistofa SchlumbergerPlatformExpress(orequivalent)tobe run
frombase ofsurfacecasingtoT.D.

'y
me
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c. Nocoresareanticipated.

d. Whetherthewell is completedas a dry hole or as a producer,"WellCompletionand
RecompletionReportandLog"(Form3160-4)willbe submittednotlaterthan30 days after
completionofthewelloraftercompletionofoperationsbeingperformed,inaccordancewith
43 CFR 3164. Twocopiesofall logs,coredescriptions,coreanalyses,well-testdata,
geologicsummaries,sampledescription,andallothersurveysordataobtainedandcompiled
duringthedrilling,workover,and/orcompletionoperations,willbe filedwithform3160-4.
Samples(cutting,fluids,and/orgases0willbe submittedwhenrequestedbytheauthorized
officer(AO).

e. The anticipatedcompletionprogramwillbe as follows:Perforate multistagefracs and
completeallproductiveMesaverdeand Wasatchsands presentin wellbore. Produceall
zones together.

f. Dailydrillingandcompletionprogressreportsshallbe submittedtotheBLMinVernalona
weeklybasis.

7. ABNORMALTEMPERATURESORPRESSURES

a. Theexpectedbottomholepressureis7663psi.Themaximumbottomholetemperaturewill
be 210 degrees Fahrenheit.

b. Nohydrogensulfidegas isanticipated.AbnormalPressureswillbe controlledwiththemud
weight.

8. ANTICIPATEDSTARTINGDATESANDNOTIFICATIONOFOPERATIONS

a. Drillingis plannedtocommenceuponapprovalofthisapplication.

b. Itis anticipatedthatthedrillingofthiswellwilltakeapproximately35 days.

c. The BLMinVernal,Utahshallbe notifiedoftheanticipateddate of locationconstruction
commencementandofanticipatedspuddate.

PERIITC0
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d. Nolocationwillbe constructedormoved,nowellwillbe plugged,andnodrillingorworkover
equipmentwillbe removedfroma welltobe placed in a suspendedstatuswithoutprior
approvalofthe AO. Ifoperationsare to be suspended,priorapprovaloftheAOwillbe
obtainedandnotificationgivenbeforeresumptionofoperations.

e. The spud date willbe reportedorallyto theAOwithin48 hours afterspudding. Ifthe
spuddingoccursonaweekendorholiday,thereportwillbesubmittedonthefollowingregular
workday. Theoralreportwillbe followedupwitha SundryNotice.

f. InaccordancewithOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,thiswellwillbe reportedonForm3160-
6 "MonthlyReportofOperations",startingwiththemonthinwhichoperationscommenceand
continueeach monthuntilthewellis physicallypluggedandabandoned. Thisreportwillbé
filedwiththeVernalBLMDistrictOffice,170 South500 East,Vernal,UT 84078.

g. ImmediateReport:Spills,blowouts,fires,leaks,accidents,oranyotherunusualoccurrences
shallbe promptlyreportedinaccordancewiththerequirementsofNTL-3Aor itsrevision.

h. Ifa replacementrigiscontemplatedforcompletionoperations,a "SundryNotice"Form3160-
5 tothateffectwillbe filed,forpriorapprovaloftheAO,and allconditionsofthisapproved
planareapplicableduringalloperationsconductedwiththereplacementrig.

i. Shouldthewellbe successfullycompletedforproduction,theAOwillbe notifiedwhenthe
wellisplacedina producingstatus.Suchnotificationwillbe sentbytelegramorotherwritten
communications,not laterthan5 days followingthedate onwhichthe wellis placed on
production.

j. PursuanttoOnshoreOrderNo.7,withtheapprovaloftheDistrictEngineer,producedwater
maybe temporarilydisposedofintounlinedpitsfora periodofup to 90 days. Duringthe
periodso authorized,an applicationforapprovalofthepermanentdisposalmethod,along
withtherequiredwater analysisandotherinformation,mustbe submittedtotheDistrict
Engineer.

k. PursuanttoNTL-4A,lessees oroperatorsareauthorizedtovent/flaregasduringinitialwell
evaluationtests,notexceedinga periodof30 days ortheproductionof50 MMCFofgas,
whicheveroccursfirst. Anapplicationmustbe filedwiththeDistrictEngineerandapproval
received,foranyventing/flaringofgasbeyondtheinitial30 dayorauthorizedtestperiod.

PER
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l. Aschematicfacilitiesdiagramas requiredby43 CFR3162.7-5(b.9.d.),shallbe submittedto
the appropriateDistrictOfficewithinsixty(60) days of installationor first production,
whicheveroccursfirst.Allsitesecurityregulationsas specifiedinOnshoreOrderNo.3 shall
be adheredto. Allproductlinesenteringand leavinghydrocarbonstoragetankswillbe
effectivelysealedinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.7-5(b.4.).

m. A first productionconferencewillbe scheduled within15 days after receiptof the first
productionnotice.

n. Nowellabandonmentoperationswillbe commencedwithoutthepriorapprovaloftheAO.
Inthecaseofnewlydrilleddryholesorfailures,and inemergencysituations,oralapproval
willbe obtainedfromtheSO. A"SubsequentReportofAbandonment"Form3160-5,willbe
filedwiththeAOwithin30daysfollowingcompletionofthewellforabandonment.Thisreport
willindicatewhere plugswere placedandthecurrentstatusofsurfacerestoration.Final
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o. PursuanttoOnshoreOilandGas OrderNo.1, lessees andoperatorshavetheresponsibility
to see thattheirexploration,development,production,and constructionoperationsare
conductedina mannerwhichconformswithapplicableFederallawsandregulationsandwith
State and local laws and regulationsto the extentthat such State and local laws are
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ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1
NOTIFICATIONREQUIREMENTS

LocationConstruction- forty-eight(48)hourspriortoconstructionoflocationandaccessroads.

LocationCompletion- priortomovingonthedrillingrig.

SpudNotice - at leasttwenty-four(24)hourspriortospuddingthewell.

CasingStringand - twenty-four(24)hourspriortorunningcasingand
Cementing cementingallcasingstrings.

BOPandRelated - twenty-four(24)hourspriortoinitiatingpressuretests.
EquipmentTests

FirstProduction- withinfive(5)businessdays afternewwellbeginsor
Notice productionresumesafterwellhas been offproductionformorethan

ninety(90)days.

The onsiteinspectionforthesubjectwellsitewas conductedonWednesday,May4, 2005at
approximately10:30a.m. Weatherconditionswerewarm,clearandsunny.Inattendanceat theonsite
inspectionwerethefollowingindividuals:

StanOlmstead NaturalResourceSpecialistBureauofLandManagement
CarlWright NaturalResourceSpecialistBureauofLandManagement
AmyTorres WildlifeBiologist BureauofLandManagement
LisaSmith PermittingAgent PermitcoInc.
VenessaLangmacher PermittingAgent PermitcoInc.
HalMarshall CivilEngineer UintahEngineeringandLandSurveying

1. EXISTINGROADS

a. Theproposedwellsiteis locatedapproximately24.6milessoutheastofMyton,Utah.
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b. Directionstothe locationfromMyton,Utahare as follows:

ProceedsouthwesterlyonHighway40for1.5miles.Turnleftandproceedsoutheasterly
forapproximately11milestotheCastlePeak Mine.Turnleftandproceedeastfor
approximately6.7 milesonthe8 mileflatroad.Stayrightandproceedsoutheasterly
approximately4.8 milesuntilreachingtheforkintheroad. Stayrightandproceed
southeasterly0.2 miles.Turnrightandproceedsouthwesterly0.1 miles.Turnrightand
proceedwesterly0.3 miles. Turnleftontotheproposedaccess andproceedsoutherly
approximately0.1 milesuntilreachingtheproposedlocation.

c. Forlocationofaccessroadswithina 2-Mileradius,see MapsA&B.

d. Improvementtoexistingmainroadswillnotbe required.

e. Allexistingroadswillbe maintainedandkeptingoodrepairduringalldrillingand
completionoperationsassociatedwiththiswell.

f. Existingroadsandnewlyconstructedroadsonsurfaceunderthejurisdictionofany
SurfaceManagingAgencyshallbe maintainedin accordancewiththestandardsofthe
SMA.

2. PLANNEDACCESSROADS

a. Approximately0.1 milesofnewconstructionwillbe necessary.The remainderofthe
accessroadis maintainedbytheCountyoris an existingoilfieldroad.

b. The maximumgradeofthenewconstructionwillbe approximately3%.

c. Noturnoutsare planned.

d. Nolowwatercrossingsorculvertswillbe necessary.

e. The last0.1 milesofnewaccessroadwas centerlineflaggedat thetimeofstaking.

f. The useofsurfacingmaterialis notanticipated,howeveritmaybe necessarydepending
onweatherconditions.
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g. Nocattleguardswillbe necessary.

h. Surfacedisturbanceandvehiculartravelwillbe limitedtotheapprovedlocationand
approvedaccessroute.Anyadditionalareaneededwillbe approvedinadvance.

i. Accessroadsandsurfacedisturbingactivitieswillconformtostandardsoutlinedinthe
BureauofLandManagementandForestServicepublication:SurfaceOperatinq
StandardsforOilandGasExplorationandDevelopment,(1989).

j. The roadwillbe constructedlupgradedtomeetthestandardsoftheanticipatedtrafficflow
andallweatherroadrequirements.Constructionlupgradingshallincludeditching,
draining,graveling,crowingandcappingtheroadbedas necessarýtoprovidea well
constructedsaferoad. Priortoupgrading,theroadshallbe clearedofanysnowcover
andallowedtodrycompletely.Travelingoffthe30footright-of-waywillnotbe allowed.
Roaddrainagecrossingsshallbe ofthetypicaldrycreekdrainagecrossingtype.
Crossingsshallbe designedso theywillnotcausesiltationoraccumulationofdebrisin
thedrainagecrossingnorshallthedrainagesbe blockedbytheroadbed.Erosionof
drainageditchesbyrunoffwatershallbe preventedbydivertingwateroffat frequent
intervalsbymeansofcutouts. Upgradingshallnotbe allowedduringmuddyconditions.
Shouldmudholesdevelop,theyshallbe filledinanddetoursaroundthemavoided.

k. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitleIllinanamountequaltoorgreater
than10,000poundswillbe used, produced,stored,transported,or disposedofannually
inassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell. Furthermore,noextremelyhazardous
substances,as definedin40 CFR355, inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used,
produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

3. LOCATIONOFEXISTINGWELLSWITHINA 1-MILERADIUSOFTHEPROPOSEDLOCATION.
(SeeMap"C")

a. Waterwells- none

b. Injectionwells- none

c. Producingwells- four

d. Drillingwells- none

PElk

ONSHOREORDERNO.1 odNFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GascoProductionCompany
SheepWash Federal#23-25-9-18 LeaseNo.U-9803
2052'FSLand1932'FWL
NESWSection25,T9S- R18E SURFACEUSEPLAN
UintahCounty,Utah Page 3

g. Nocattleguardswillbe necessary.

h. Surfacedisturbanceandvehiculartravelwillbe limitedtotheapprovedlocationand
approvedaccessroute.Anyadditionalareaneededwillbe approvedinadvance.

i. Accessroadsandsurfacedisturbingactivitieswillconformtostandardsoutlinedinthe
BureauofLandManagementandForestServicepublication:SurfaceOperatinq
StandardsforOilandGasExplorationandDevelopment,(1989).

j. The roadwillbe constructedlupgradedtomeetthestandardsoftheanticipatedtrafficflow
andallweatherroadrequirements.Constructionlupgradingshallincludeditching,
draining,graveling,crowingandcappingtheroadbedas necessarýtoprovidea well
constructedsaferoad. Priortoupgrading,theroadshallbe clearedofanysnowcover
andallowedtodrycompletely.Travelingoffthe30footright-of-waywillnotbe allowed.
Roaddrainagecrossingsshallbe ofthetypicaldrycreekdrainagecrossingtype.
Crossingsshallbe designedso theywillnotcausesiltationoraccumulationofdebrisin
thedrainagecrossingnorshallthedrainagesbe blockedbytheroadbed.Erosionof
drainageditchesbyrunoffwatershallbe preventedbydivertingwateroffat frequent
intervalsbymeansofcutouts. Upgradingshallnotbe allowedduringmuddyconditions.
Shouldmudholesdevelop,theyshallbe filledinanddetoursaroundthemavoided.

k. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitleIllinanamountequaltoorgreater
than10,000poundswillbe used, produced,stored,transported,or disposedofannually
inassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell. Furthermore,noextremelyhazardous
substances,as definedin40 CFR355, inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used,
produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

3. LOCATIONOFEXISTINGWELLSWITHINA 1-MILERADIUSOFTHEPROPOSEDLOCATION.
(SeeMap"C")

a. Waterwells- none

b. Injectionwells- none

c. Producingwells- four

d. Drillingwells- none

PElk



ONSHOREORDERNO.1 bdNFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GascoProductionCompany
Sheep Wash Federal #23-25-9-18 Lease No.U-9803
2052' FSLand1932' FWL
NESWSection25,T9S- R18E SURFACEUSEPLAN
UintahCounty,Utah Page 4

e. Shut-inwells- none

f. Temporarilyabandonedwells- none

g. Disposalwells-none

h. Abandonedwells-four

4. LOCATIONOFTANKBATTERIESANDPRODUCTIONFACILITIES.

a. Allpermanentstructures(onsiteforsixmonthsor longer)constructedorinstalled
(includingoilwellpumpjacks)willbe paintedCarlsbadCanyon.Allfacilitieswillbe
paintedwithinsixmonthsofinstallation.Facilitiesrequiredtocomplywiththe
OccupationalSafetyandHealthAct(OSHA)willbe excluded.

b. Ifstoragefacilities/tankbatteriesareconstructedonthislease, thefacilitylbatteryorthe
wellpadshallsurroundedbya containmentdikeofsufficientcapacitytocontainata
minimum,theentirecontentsofthe largesttankwithinthefacility/battery,unlessmore
stringentprotectiverequirementsaredeemed necessarybytheauthorizedofficer.

c. Aproductionfacilitylayoutisattached.

d. Allloadinglineswillbe placedinsidethebermsurroundingthetankbattery.

e. Gasmeterrunsforeachwellwillbe locatedwithin500feetofthewellhead.The gasflow
linewillbe buriedoranchoreddownfromthewellheadtothemeterand 500 feet
downstreamofthemeterrunoranyproductionfacilities.Meterrunswillbe housed
and/orfenced.

f. Theoilandgas measurementfacilitieswillbe installedonthewelllocation.The oiland
gas meterswillbe calibratedinplacepriortoanydeliveries.Tests formeteraccuracywill
be conductedmonthlyforthefirstthreemonthsonnewmeterinstallationsandat least
quarterlythereafter.TheAOwillbe providedwitha date andtimefortheinitialmeter
calibrationandallfuturemeterprovingschedules.Acopyofthemetercalibrationreports
willbe submittedtotheVernalFieldOffice.Allmetermeasurementfacilitieswillconform
withOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.4 forliquidhydrocarbonsandOnshoreOilandGas
OrderNo.5 fornaturalgas measurement.
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g. Ifat anytimethefacilitieslocatedon publiclandandauthorizedbythetermsofthelease
arenolongerincludedinthe lease (duetoa contractionintheunitorotherlease orunit
boundarychange),BLMwillprocessa changeinauthorizationtotheappropriatestatute.
The authorizationwillbe subjecttoappropriaterentalorotherfinancialobligationas
determinedbytheauthorizedofficer.

h. Anynecessarypitswillbe properlyfencedtopreventanywildlifeentry.

i. Allsitesecurityguidelinesidentifiedin43 CFR3162.7regulationswillbe adheredto.

j. Alloff-leasestorage,off-leasemeasurement,orcomminglingon-leaseoroff-leasewill
have priorwrittenapprovalfromtheDistrictManager.

k. Allaccessroadswillbe maintainedas necessarytopreventerosionandaccommodate
year-roundtraffic.

l. The roadwillbe maintainedina safeuseablecondition.

m. Producedwaterwillbe stored in a 300 bblheated, insulated tank,thenhauledtoa
commercialdisposalsitesuchas DisposalInc.,orBrennanBottom.

n. PipelineswillfollowtherouteshownonMapD. See Pipelinedetailattached.

5. LOCATIONANDTYPEOFWATERSUPPLY

a. The proposedwatersourcewillbe theNebeckerWaterServiceat theNebeckerWater
StationinMyton,permit#43-1723,orproducedfieldwater.

b. Waterwillbe hauledbyNebeckerWaterServicetothelocationovertheaccessroads
shownonMapsAandB.

c. Nowaterwellwillbe drilledonthislease.

6. SOURCEOFCONSTRUCTIONMATERIAL

a. Surfaceandsubsoilmaterialsintheimmediateareawillbe utilized.
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b. Anygravelused willbe obtainedfroma commercialsource.

c. The use ofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformwith43 CFR3610.2.3.
Constructionmaterialwillnotbe locatedon lease.

d. Noconstructionmaterialswillbe removedfromFederalland.

7. METHODSOFHANDLINGWASTEDISPOSAL

a. The reservepitwillbe constructedsoas nottoleak,break,orallowdischarge.

b. AttherequestoftheBLM,thereservepitwillbe linedwitha 12 milliner. Iffracturedrock
is encountered,thepitwillbe firstlinedwithsufficientbedding(eitherstrawordirt)to
coveranyrocks.The linerwilloverlapthepitwallsandbe coveredwithdirtand/orrocks
toholditinplace.Notrash,scrappipe,etc.,thatcouldpuncturethelinerwillbe disposed
ofinthepit. Morestringentprotectiverequirementsmaybe deemednecessarybythe
A.O.

c. Burningwillnotbe allowed.Alltrashwillbe containedina trashcageand its contents
removedat theendofdrillingoperationsandhauledtoanapproveddisposalsight.

d. Afterfirstproduction,producedwastewaterwillbe confinedtoa unlinedpitorstorage
tankfora periodnottoexceedninety(90)days. Duringthe90-dayperiod,inaccordance
withOnshoreOrderNo.7,anapplicationforapprovalofa permanentdisposalmethod
and location,alongwiththerequiredwateranalysis,willbe submittedfortheAO's
approval.Failuretofilean applicationwithinthetimeallowedwillbe consideredan
incidentofnoncompliance.

e. Drillcuttingsaretobe containedandburiedinthereservepit.

f. Anysaltsand/orchemicalswhicharean integralpartofthedrillingsystemwillbe
disposedofinthesamemanneras thedrillingfluid.

g. Achemicalporta-toiletwillbe furnishedwiththedrillingrig.

h. The producedfluidswillbe producedintoa testtankuntilsuchtimeas constructionof
productionfacilitiesiscompleted.Anyspillsofoil,gas saltwaterorotherproducedfluids
willbe cleanedupandremoved. y Reg
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8. ANCILLARYFACILITIES

Thereare noairstrips,camps,orotherfacilitiesplannedduringthedrillingoftheproposedwell.

9. WELLSITELAYOUT

a. Theoperatororhis/hercontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficeat 435/781-4400forty-
eight(48)hourspriortoconstructionactivities.

b. The reservepitwillbe locatedon thewest sideofthe location.

c. Theflarepitwillbe locatedonthenorthsideofthereservepit, a minimumof100feet
fromthewellhead and 20 feet fromthereservepitfence.

d. Thestockpiledtopsoil(firstsixinches)willbe storedonthewestsidebetweenCorners6
and7 nearthewellpad.Topsoilalongtheaccessroutewillbe windrowedontheuphill
side. Pittopsoilwillbe storednearthepit.

e. Accesstothewellpadwillbe fromthenorthas shownonthePit&Pad Layout.

f. See LocationLayoutfororientationofrig,crosssectionofdrillpad andcutsandfills.

g. The locationofmudtanks;reservepit,trashcage;piperacks;livingfacilitiesand soil
stockpileswillbe shownontheLocationLayout.

h. Allpitswillbe fencedaccordingtothefollowingminimumstandards:

1. 39 inchnetwireshallbe usedwithat least onestrandorbarbedwireontopof
thenetwire(barbedwireis notnecessaryifpipeorsometypeofreinforcement
rodis attachedtothetopoftheentirefence).

2. Thenetwireshallbe nomorethan2-inchesabovetheground.The barbedwire
shallbe 3-inchesabovethenetwire. Totalheightofthefenceshallbe at least
42-inches.
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3. Cornerposts shallbe cementedand/orbraced in sucha mannertokeep the
fencetightat alltimes.

4. Standardsteel,wood,or pipeposts shallbe used betweenthecornerbraces.
Maximumdistancebetweenanytwopostsshallbe no greaterthan16feet.

5. Allwireshallbe stretched,byusinga stretchingdevice,beforeitis attachedto
thecornerposts.

i. The reservepitfencingwillbe onthreesidesduringdrillingoperationsandonthefourth
sidewhentherigmovesoffthelocation.Pitswillbe fencedandmaintaineduntilcleanup.

10. PLANSFORRESTORATIONOFSURFACE

ProducingLocation

a. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,the locationandsurroundingareawillbe clearedofall
unusedtubing,equipment,debris,materials,trashandjunknot requiredforproduction.

b. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,anyhydrocarbonsonthepitshallbe removedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.7-1.

c. Ifa plasticnylonreinforcedlineris used itshallbe tornandperforatedbeforebackfillingof
thereservepit.

d. The reservepitandthatportionofthelocationnotneededforproductionfacilitiesor
operationswillbe recontouredtotheapproximatenaturalcontours.The reservepitwillbe
reclaimedwithin120days fromthedate ofwellcompletion.Beforeanydirtworktakes
place,thereservepitmusthave allfluidsandhydrocarbonsremovedandallcans,
barrels,pipe,etc.,willbe removed.

e. Reclamationofunuseddisturbedareasonthewellpadlaccess roadno longerneeded for
operations,suchas cutslopes,andfillareaswillbe accomplishedbygrading,leveling
andseedingas recommendedbytheAuthorizedOfficer.Aseed mixturewillbe specified
bytheBureauofLandManagementintheirConditionsofApprovalforthesubjectwell.

PER
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Seedingwillbe performedimmediatelyafterthe locationhas been reclaimedandthepit
has been backfilled,regardlessofthetimeofyear. Seedwillbe broadcastandwalkedin
witha dozer.

f. Thetopsoilstockpilewillbe seededas soonas thelocationhas been constructedwiththe
samerecommendedseedmix.Theseedwillbe walkedinwitha cat.

g. Thefollowingseedmixturehas been recommendedbytheBLM.

Species #/s perAcre

Shadscale 4

Galleta 4

GardnersSaltbush 4

TOTAL 12

DryHole

h. Atsuchtimeas thewellis pluggedandabandoned,theoperatorshallsubmita
subsequentreportofabandonmentand BLMwillattachtheappropriatesurface
rehabilitationconditionsofapproval.

11. SURFACEOWNERSHIP

AccessRoads - AlloftheaccessroadsaremaintainedbytheCountyRoadDepartmentor the
BureauofLandManagement.

Wellpad - Thewellpadis locatedon landsmanagedbytheBLM.

PElk
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12. OTHERINFORMATION

a. AClass Illarcheologicalsurveyhas been conductedbyGrandRiverInstitute.Acopyof
thisreportis attached.

b. Theoperatoris responsibleforinformingallpersonsintheareaswhoareassociatedwith
thisprojectthattheywillbe subjecttoprosecutionforknowinglydisturbinghistoricor
archaeologicalsites,orforcollectingartifacts.Ifhistoricorarchaeologicalmaterialsare
uncoveredduringconstruction,theoperatoris toimmediatelystopworkthatmightfurther
disturbsuchmaterials,andcontacttheauthorizedofficer(AO).Withinfiveworkingdays
theAOwillinformtheoperatoras to:

-whether thematerialsappeareligiblefortheNationalRegisterofHistoricPlaces;

-the mitigationmeasurestheoperatorwilllikelyhave toundertakebeforethesitecanbe
used(assuminginsitupreservationis notnecessary);and

-a timeframefortheAOtocompleteandexpeditedreviewunder36 CFR800.11to
confirm,throughtheStateHistoricPreservationOfficer,thatthefindingsoftheAOare
correctandthatmitigationisappropriate.Iftheoperatorwishes,at anytime,torelocate
activitiestoavoidtheexpenseofmitigationand/orthedelaysassociatedwiththis
process,theAOwillassumeresponsibilityforwhateverrecordationandstabilizationof
theexposedmaterialsmaybe required.Otherwise,theoperatorwillbe responsiblefor
mitigationcosts. TheAOwillprovidetechnicalandproceduralguidelinesfortheconduct
ofmitigation.UponverificationfromtheAOthatrequiredmitigationhas beencompleted,
theoperatorwillthenbe allowedto resumeconstruction.

c. Theoperatorwillcontrolnoxiousweedsalongrights-of-wayforroads,pipelines,wellsites,
orotherapplicablefacilities.Alistofnoxiousweeds maybe obtainedfromtheBLM,or
theappropriateCountyExtensionOffice.On BLMadministeredlanditis requiredthata
PesticideUse Proposalshallbe submitted,andgivenapproval,priortotheapplicationof
herbicidesorotherpesticidesorpossiblehazardouschemicals.

d. Drillingrigsand/orequipmentused duringdrillingoperationsonthiswellsitewillnotbe
stackedorstoredonFederalLandsaftertheconclusionofdrillingoperationsorat any
othertimewithoutBLMauthorization.However,ifBLMauthorizationis obtained,it is only
a temporarymeasure.
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e. Alllease and/orunitoperationswillbe conductedinsucha mannerthatfullcomplianceis
madewithallapplicablelaws,regulations,OnshoreOiland GasOrders,theapproved
planofoperations,and anyapplicableNoticeto Lessees. Theoperatorisfully
responsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe
furnishedthefieldrepresentativeto insurecompliance.

f. AcompletecopyoftheapprovedAPDshallbe on locationduringconstructionofthe
locationanddrillingactivities.

g. There willbe nodeviationfromtheproposeddrillingand/orworkoverprogramwithout
priorapprovalfromtheAO.Safedrillingandoperatingpracticesmustbe observed.All
wells,whetherdrilling,producing,suspendedorabaridonedwillbe identifiedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.

h. "SundryNoticeandReportonWells"(Form3160-5)willbe filedforapprovalforall
changesofplansandotheroperationsinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.3-2.

i. Thispermitwillbe validfora periodofoneyear fromthedate ofapproval.Anextension
periodmaybe granted,ifrequested,priortotheexpirationoftheoriginalapprovalperiod.
Afterpermittermination,a newapplicationwillbe filedforapprovalforanyfuture
operations.

j. TheoperatororhiscontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficesat 435/781-440048 hours
priortoconstructionactivities.

k. The BLMOfficeshallbe notifieduponsitecompletionpriorto movingonthedrillingrig.

13. LESSEE'SOROPERATOR'SREPRESENTATIVEANDCERTIFICATION

PermitMatters Drilling&CompletionMatters

PERMITC0INC. GascoProduction Company
14421CountyRoad10 8 InvernessDriveEast,Suite100
Ft.Lupton,CO80621 Englewood,CO80112
303/857-9999(0) John Longwell
303/857-0577(F) 303/483-0044(0)
LisaSmith 303/483-0011(F)

ShawnElworthy- FieldSuperintendent
Roosevelt,UT
435-823-4272
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CERTIFICATION

IherebycertifythatI,orpersonsundermydirectsupervision,have inspectedtheproposeddrill
siteandaccessroute;thatIamfamiliarwiththeconditionswhichpresentlyexist;thatthe
statementsmadeinthisplanare,tothebest ofmyknowledge,trueandcorrect;and, thatthe
workassociatedwiththeoperationsproposedhereinwillbe performedbyGasco Production
Companyanditscontractorsandsubcontractorsinconformitywiththeplanandthetermsand
conditionsunderwhichitisapproved.

Thisstatementis subjecttotheprovisionsof 18.U.S.C.1001 forthefilingofa falsestatement.

May19, 2005 AUVuY)L ftm1ût Al
Date: Venessa Langmacher- ÈRMITCOINC.

AuthorizedAgentfor:
Gasco ProductionCompany

PEIL
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PIPELINE INFORMATION
Sheep Wash Federal #23-25-9-18

1. The type of pipeline is a single well flow line.

2. The outside diameter (O.D.) of all willbe 8 inches or smaller.

3. The anticipated production throughthe line is approximately 2000 MCF per day.

4. The anticipated maximum test pressure is 1000 psi.

5. The anticipated operating pressure is 150 psi.

6. The type of pipe is steel.

7. The method of coupling is welded.

8. There are no other pipelines to be associated in same right of way.

9. There are no other objects to be associated in the same right of way.

10. The total length of pipeline is approximately 2800 feet - see Map D.

11. The line will be laid on the surface, adjacent to the road as shown on Map D.

12. The pipeline willonly be buried under existing road crossings, prior to reaching the
tie-inpoint. Backfilling willonly be necessary where the pipeline crosses under the
road.

13. The construction width needed for totalsurface disturbing activities is 30 feet.

14. The estimated total acreage involving all surface disturbing activities is 1.9 acres.

15. Any surface disturbance created as a result of the pipeline construction will be
reclaimed utilizingthe reclamation procedures and seed mixture specified by the
Bureau of Land
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GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
SHEEP WASH FEDERAL #23-25-9-18

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 25, T9S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.
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+ Grand River Institute *
P.O. Box 3543 # Grand Junction, CO 81502 + 970/245-7868 FAX 970/245-6317

April 30, 2005

Gasco, Inc.
14 Inverness Drive East
Suite H-236
Englewood, CO 80112

Attn: Mike Decker

Re: GRI Project No. 2515 - Class III cultural resources inventory of eight proposed well

locations (Fed. #21-30-9-19, Fed. #23-19-9-19, Fed. #41-30-9-19, Fed. #43-19-9-19,

Sheep Wash Fed. #21-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #41-

25-9-18, and Sheep Wash Fed. #43-25-9-18) and 1.85 miles of linear routes in the Sheep
Wash area of Uintah County, Utah [UO5-GB-0236b] ·

GRI Project No. 2516 - Class III cultural resources inventory for the proposed Wilkin

Ridge Fed. #21-12-11-17 and related access/ pipeline route (9050 feet) in Uintah

County, Utah, [UO5-GB-0079bs]

GRI Project No. 2517 - Class III cultural resources inventory for the proposed Gate
Canyon State #34-21-11-15 well location and its related new access and pipeline routes

(5310 feet) in Duchesne County, Utah [UO5-GB-0235s]

Dear Mike:

Enclosed are two copies of our final reports for the above cited projects. Copies have

been distributed as indicated below. Also enclosed is our invoice. Please call me if you

have any questions or comments.

Sincerely,

Carl E. Conner
Director

Enc.

Distribution:
4 (2, 2516 and 2, 2517) - Kenny Wintch, Utah State Land Trust
4 (2, 2515 and 2, 2516) - Blaine Phillips, BLM Vernal Field Office

1 ea) - Lisa Smith, Permitco

Archaeology + Paleontology + History * Environmental

+ Grand River Institute *
P.O. Box 3543 # Grand Junction, CO 81502 + 970/245-7868 FAX 970/245-6317

April 30, 2005

Gasco, Inc.
14 Inverness Drive East
Suite H-236
Englewood, CO 80112

Attn: Mike Decker

Re: GRI Project No. 2515 - Class III cultural resources inventory of eight proposed well

locations (Fed. #21-30-9-19, Fed. #23-19-9-19, Fed. #41-30-9-19, Fed. #43-19-9-19,

Sheep Wash Fed. #21-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #41-

25-9-18, and Sheep Wash Fed. #43-25-9-18) and 1.85 miles of linear routes in the Sheep
Wash area of Uintah County, Utah [UO5-GB-0236b] ·

GRI Project No. 2516 - Class III cultural resources inventory for the proposed Wilkin

Ridge Fed. #21-12-11-17 and related access/ pipeline route (9050 feet) in Uintah

County, Utah, [UO5-GB-0079bs]

GRI Project No. 2517 - Class III cultural resources inventory for the proposed Gate
Canyon State #34-21-11-15 well location and its related new access and pipeline routes

(5310 feet) in Duchesne County, Utah [UO5-GB-0235s]

Dear Mike:

Enclosed are two copies of our final reports for the above cited projects. Copies have

been distributed as indicated below. Also enclosed is our invoice. Please call me if you

have any questions or comments.

Sincerely,

Carl E. Conner
Director

Enc.

Distribution:
4 (2, 2516 and 2, 2517) - Kenny Wintch, Utah State Land Trust
4 (2, 2515 and 2, 2516) - Blaine Phillips, BLM Vernal Field Office

1 ea) - Lisa Smith, Permitco

Archaeology + Paleontology + History * Environmental



+ Grand River Institute *
P.O. Box 3543 # Grand Junction, CO 81502 # 970/245-7868 # FAX 970/245-6317

May 2, 2005

Antiquities Section
Division of State History
300 Rio Grand, Suite 210
Salt Lake City, Utah 84101

Attn: Jim Dykmann

Re: GRI Project No. 2516 - Class III cultural resources inventory for the proposed Wilkin
Ridge Fed. #21-12-11-17 and related access/ pipeline route (9050 feet) in Uintah
County, Utah, [UO5-GB-0079bs]

GRI Project No. 2517 - Class III cultural resources inventory for the proposed Gate
Canyon State #34-21-11-15 well location and its related new access and pipeline routes
(5310 feet) in Duchesne County, Utah [UO5-GB-0235s]

Dear Jim:

As requested by Kenny Wintch, Archaeologist for the Trust Lands Administration, I
have forwarded one copy each of the above cited reports. Please call me if you have any
questions or require additional information.

Sincerely,

Carl E. Conner
Director

CC:cee

Enc.

cc: Kenny Wintch
isa Smith, Permitco

Archaeology * Paleontology * History # Environmental
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UTAII STATE COVER PAGE

Must Accompany All Project Reports
Submitted to Utah SHPO

Project Name: Class IH cultural resources inventory of eight proposed well locations (Fed.

#21-30-9-19, Fed. #23-19-9-19, Fed. #41-30-9-19, Fed. #43-19-9-19, Sheep Wash Fed. #21-

25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #41-25-9-18, and Sheep Wash

Fed. #43-25-9-18) and 1.85 miles of linear routes in the Sheep Wash area of Uintah County
State Proj. No. UO5-GB-0236b

Report Date: 4/29/2005 County(ies): Uintah

Principal Investigator: Carl E. Conner Field Supervisor(s): Carl E. Conner

Records search completed at: BLM and UDSH Record search date(s): 4/21/05 and 4/6/2005

Acreage Surveyed ~ Intensive: 120 acres Recon/Intuitive: 0 acres

7.5' Series USGS Map Reference(s): Uteland Butte 1964 and Moon Bottom 1985

Sites Reported Count Smithsonian Site Numbers

Archaeological Sites 0
Revisits (no inventory form update)

Revisits (updated IMACS site 2 42UN1180 and 42UN2931
inventory form attached)

New recordings (IMACS site 3 42UN4790, 42UN4791, and 42UN4792

inventory form attached)

Total Count of Archaeological Sites 5

Historic Structures (USHS 106 site 0
info form attached)

Total National Register Eligible Sites 4 42UN2931, 42UN4790, 42UN4791, and
42UN4792

----------------Checklist of Required Items------------------
1. X Copy of the Final Report
2._X_Copy of7.5' Series USGS Map with Surveyed/Excavated Area Clearly Identified.
3. Completed IMACS Site Inventory Forms, Including

X Parts A and B or C, _X_The IMACS Encoding Form,
X_Site Sketch Map, X Photographs
X_Copy of the appropriate 7.5' Series USGS Map w/ the Site Location Clearly Marked and Labeled with

the Smithsonian Site Number
4._X _Completed "Cover Sheet" Accompanying Final Report and Survey Materials (Please make certain all of your

checked items are

UTAII STATE COVER PAGE

Must Accompany All Project Reports
Submitted to Utah SHPO

Project Name: Class IH cultural resources inventory of eight proposed well locations (Fed.

#21-30-9-19, Fed. #23-19-9-19, Fed. #41-30-9-19, Fed. #43-19-9-19, Sheep Wash Fed. #21-

25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #41-25-9-18, and Sheep Wash

Fed. #43-25-9-18) and 1.85 miles of linear routes in the Sheep Wash area of Uintah County
State Proj. No. UO5-GB-0236b

Report Date: 4/29/2005 County(ies): Uintah

Principal Investigator: Carl E. Conner Field Supervisor(s): Carl E. Conner

Records search completed at: BLM and UDSH Record search date(s): 4/21/05 and 4/6/2005

Acreage Surveyed ~ Intensive: 120 acres Recon/Intuitive: 0 acres

7.5' Series USGS Map Reference(s): Uteland Butte 1964 and Moon Bottom 1985

Sites Reported Count Smithsonian Site Numbers

Archaeological Sites 0
Revisits (no inventory form update)

Revisits (updated IMACS site 2 42UN1180 and 42UN2931
inventory form attached)

New recordings (IMACS site 3 42UN4790, 42UN4791, and 42UN4792

inventory form attached)

Total Count of Archaeological Sites 5

Historic Structures (USHS 106 site 0
info form attached)

Total National Register Eligible Sites 4 42UN2931, 42UN4790, 42UN4791, and
42UN4792

----------------Checklist of Required Items------------------
1. X Copy of the Final Report
2._X_Copy of7.5' Series USGS Map with Surveyed/Excavated Area Clearly Identified.
3. Completed IMACS Site Inventory Forms, Including

X Parts A and B or C, _X_The IMACS Encoding Form,
X_Site Sketch Map, X Photographs
X_Copy of the appropriate 7.5' Series USGS Map w/ the Site Location Clearly Marked and Labeled with

the Smithsonian Site Number
4._X _Completed "Cover Sheet" Accompanying Final Report and Survey Materials (Please make certain all of your

checked items are



Form UT-8100-3 UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Page 1 of 2

(December 2000) BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
UTAH STATE OFFICE

Summary Report of Cultural
Resources Inspection Project No.: U05-GB-0236b [GRI No. 2515]

1. Report Title: Class IH cultural resources inventory of eight proposed well locations (Fed.
#21-30-9-19, Fed. #23-19-9-19, Fed. #41-30-9-19, Fed. #43-19-9-19, Sheep Wash Fed. #21-

25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #41-25-9-18, and Sheep Wash

Fed. #43-25-9-18) and 1.85 miles of linear routes in the Sheep Wash area of Uintah County

2. Report Date: 4/29/2005 3. Date(s) of Survey: 22nd and 23" of April 2005

4. Development Company: Gasco Production Company

5. Responsible Institution: BLM Vernal Office

6. Responsible Individuals Principal Investigator: Field Supervisor: Carl E. Conner

Report Author(s): Carl E. Conner

7. BLM Field Office: Vernal Field Office

8. County(ies): Uintah

9. Fieldwork Location: T.9S., R.18E., Sec. 25; and, T.9S., R.19E., Sec. 19 and 30; SLBM

10. Record Search:

Location of Records Searched for BLM: BLM Vernal/UDSH Date: 4/21/05 and 4/6/2005

11. Description of Proposed Project: Eight proposed weH Iocations and a 1.85 miles of access

roads/ pipeline routes
12. Description of Examination Procedures: A Class IH, 100% pedestrian, cultural resources

survey of the proposed weH locations was made by walking a series of concentric circles

around the flagged centers to diameters of 750 feet. The related access and pipeline routes

not included within the 10-acre study plots were surveyed by walking four paraBel
transects spaced at 15m intervals and centered on the flagged lines to cover corridors 200

feet wide (60m). A total of about 120 acres was intensively surveyed. The basic approach
to the data coHection was the continuous mapping of observed artifacts and features by

recording UTM coordinates (NAD 83 Datum) using a Trimble Geo XT. Site maps were

created using differentiaHy corrected data together with AreMap. Photographs were taken
at each site and include general views and specifie artifacts or features. Field notes and

photo negatives are filed at Grand River Institute, while the photographs are submitted to
the BLM and UDSH. No artifacts were
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13. Area Surveyed: BLM OTHER FED TATE PRI.

Linear Miles Intensive: 1.85

Recon/Intuitive:

Acreage Intensive: 75

Recon/Intuitive:

14. Sites Recorded:

Smithsonian Site Numbers # BLM OTHER FED STATE PRI.

Revisits NR Eligible 0

(no IMACS form) Not Eligible 0

Revisits NR Eligible 1 42UN2931

updated IMACS) Not Eligible 1 42UN1180

New NR Eligible 3 42UN4790
42UN4791

Recordings 42UN4792

Not Eligible 0

Total Number of 5

Archaeological Sites

Historic Structures 0

(USHS Form)

Total National Register 4 42UN2931
42UN4790

Eligible Sites 42UN4791
42UN4792

15. Description of Findings: (see attached report) As a result, two isolated finds and three
sites (42UN4790, 42UN4791 and 42UN4792) were recorded. Two previously recorded sites

(42UN1180 and 42UN2931) were revisited to ascertain their relationship to the proposed

well locations.
16. Collection Yes N_o

17. Conclusion/Recommendations: The newly recorded sites and 42UN2931 were field

evaluated as significant and eligible for listing on the National Register of Historic Places.

Site 42UN1180 was previously evaluated as non-significant and no change was made to that
evaluation. Site 42UN4790 is presently within the proposed impact area for the Fed. #41-

30-9-19 well location. It should be avoided. A 5-acre addition was inventoried west of the
welPs original 10-acre block survey area to allow for the well center's movement in that
direction. The remaining sites will be avoided, so no further work is recommended.
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Abstract

Grand River Institute conducted a Class III cultural resources inventory for Gasco
Production Company of eight proposed well locations (Fed. #21-30-9-19, Fed. #23-19-9-19,
Fed. #41-30-9-19, Fed. #43-19-9-19, Sheep Wash Fed. #21-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #23-

25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #41-25-9-18, and Sheep Wash Fed. #43-25-9-18) and 1.85 miles

(9740 feet) of linear routes (roads and/or pipelines) in Uintah County, Utah, under BLM
Antiquities Permit No. 05UT-54939 and Utah Division of State History (UDSH) Project
Authorization No. UO5-GB-0236b. This work was done to meet requirements of Federal
and State laws that protect cultural resources.

Files searches conducted through the BLM Vernal District Office (BLM) and
through the UDSH indicated two sites (42UN1180 and 42TJN2931) were previously
recorded in the project areas. Field work was performed on the 22ndand 23rdof April 2005.

A total of about 120 acres (BLM) was inspected. As a result, two isolated finds and three
sites (42UN4790, 42UN4791 and 42UN4792) were recorded. The two previously recorded
sites (42UN1180 and 42UN2931) were revisited to ascertain their relationship to the
proposed well locations. The newly recorded sites and 42UN2931 were field evaluated as
significant and eligible for listing on the National Register of Historic Places. Site
42UN1180 was previously evaluated as non-significant and no change was made to that
evaluation.

Site 42UN4790 is presently within the proposed impact area for the Fed. #41-30-9-

19 well location. It should be avoided. A 5-acre addition was inventoried west of the welPs
original 10-acre block survey area to allow for the well center's movement in that direction.
The remaining sites will be avoided, so no further work is recommended.
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Introduction

At the request of Gasco Production Company and the Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office (BLM), Grand River Institute conducted a Class III cultural resources

inventory for Gasco Production Company of eight proposed well locations (Fed. #21-30-9-

19, Fed. #23-19-9-19, Fed. #41-30-9-19, Fed. #43-19-9-19, Sheep Wash Fed. #21-25-9-18,
Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #41-25-9-18, and Sheep Wash Fed. #43-

25-9-18) and 1.85 miles (9740 feet) of linear routes (roads and/or pipelines) under BLM
Antiquities Permit No. 05UT-54939 and Utah Division of State History (UDSH) Project
Authorization No. UO5-GB-0236b. The file searches, survey and report were completed by
Carl E. Conner (Principal Investigator) and Barbara J. Davenport of GRI. Field work was

performed on the 22" and 23" of April 2005. A total of 120 acres (BLM) was inspected.

The survey was done to meet requirements of the Federal Land Policy and
Management Act of 1976, the National Historic Preservation Act as amended in 1992, and

the National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) of 1969. These laws are concerned with the
identification, evaluation, and protection of fragile, non-renewable evidences of human
activity, occupation and endeavor reflected in districts, sites, structures, artifacts, objects,

ruins, works of art, architecture, and natural features that were of importance in human
events. Such resources tend to be localized and highly sensitive to disturbance.

Location of Project Aren

The study area's discrete units lie southwest of Vernal, Utah, in the Sheep Wash area
of Uintah County. The 10-acre blocks surveyed for the proposed new well locations, and the
200-foot-wide corridors inventoried for the proposed new access roads and/or pipeline
routes are in T. 9 S., R. 18 E., Section 25; and, T. 9 S., R. 19 E., Sections 19 and 30; SLBM.

Environment

The project areas are within the major geologic subdivision of the Colorado Plateau
known as the Uinta Basin Section. In Utah, this section extends from the Uinta Mountains
on the north to the Book Cliffs on the south. It is a broad downwarp into which Quaternary-
and Tertiary-age deposits were made from the surrounding mountains which include
Holocene and Pleistocene pediment deposits, and Eocene-age fluvial and lacustrine
sedimentary rocks (Rigby 1976:xi). Physiographically, the basin includes the Uinta basin in
the north portion and the Book Cliffs/Roan Plateau in the south portion. The lower Uinta
Formation is the bedrock of the study area. Holocene and Pleistocene-age alluvium and
colluvium occur as a veneer over the Uinta. It consists of channel and flood-plain stream
deposits. Soils encountered were rocky, shaley, silty, and sandy loams, which are in general
formed in residuum from the underlying formation. However, dunes are common in this
region as well.
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Figure 1. Project location map for the Class III cultural resource inventory for eight proposed

Sheep Wash area Federal well locations and related new access/pipeline routes (1.85 miles)

in Uintah County for Gasco Production Company. Areas surveyed for cultural resources are

highlighted. [GRI Project No. #2515, 4/29/05]
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Elevations in the project area range from 4780-to-4950 feet. The terrain is
characterized as bench land that is cut by dendritic washes. Vegetation is a shadscale desert
community throughout most of the area. Notably, Indian Ricegrass occurs on the stabilized
dunes that border many of the small buttes in the area, and may have been a significant
source of food for the native inhabitants. Regional faunal inhabitants include deer, antelope,
elk, black bear, coyote, mountain lion, cottontails, jack rabbits, and various raptores.

A cool, mid-latitude steppe climate prevails. Annual precipitation of this elevation
range is between 7 and 10 inches. Temperatures range from 100°F in the summer to -40°F

in January. Paleoenvironmental data are scant, but it is generally agreed that gross climatic
conditions have remained fairly constant over the last 12,000 years. However, changes in
effective moisture, and cooling-warming trends probably affected the prehistoric occupation

of the region.

Files Search

Files searches were conducted through BLM and UDSH. Previous projects in the
areas near the inventory blocks and linear routes are numerous and generally relate to oil and

gas development. Those that are adjacent to the project areas are discussed below.

Numerous projects have been completed in the Sections indicated in the Location of
Project portion of the report. Significant to this report are those projects shown on Figure I,
including: U80-AF-0516b, U81-NH-429, UOO-AY-319bs, UOO-AF-206b, U00-AF-576b,
and UOl-MQ-694b.Of those, U00-AY-319bs and UOO-AF-576bs cover the area for the
proposed pipeline route to the Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18. Also the existing road to the
Sheep Wash Fed. #43-25-9-18 has been inventoried by two projects: UOO-AF-206b and
U00-AF-576bs. Project UO1-MQ-694bincludes two 40-acre blocks that overlay two
portions of our project area: the proposed Fed. #23-19-9-19 and a nearby road/pipeline
segment. With the 40-acre block that includes the proposed Fed. #23-19-9-19, site
42UN2931 was previously recorded. Site 42UN1180 was recorded as part of project #U81-
NH-429, and occurs along the north border of the 10-acre study area for the Sheep Wash
Fed. #41-25-9-18. Both the previously recorded sites were relocated to determine their
relationship to the proposed actions.

Regional archaeological studies suggest nearly continuous human occupation of
northeastern Utah for the past 12,000 years. Evidence of the Paleoindian Tradition, the
Archaic Tradition, Fremont Culture, and Protohistoric/Historic Utes has been found.
Historic records suggest occupation or use by EuroAmerican trappers, settlers, miners, and
ranchers as well. Overviews of the prehistory and history of the region are provided in the
Utah BLM Cultural Resource Series No. 11, Archaeological Inventory in the Seep Ridge
Cultural Study Tract, Uintah County, Northeastern Utah with a Regional Predictive Model
for Site Locations (Chandler and Larralde 1980), and in Cultural Resources Existing Data
Inventorv Vernal District, Utah (Jones and Mackay 1980).

Elevations in the project area range from 4780-to-4950 feet. The terrain is
characterized as bench land that is cut by dendritic washes. Vegetation is a shadscale desert
community throughout most of the area. Notably, Indian Ricegrass occurs on the stabilized
dunes that border many of the small buttes in the area, and may have been a significant
source of food for the native inhabitants. Regional faunal inhabitants include deer, antelope,
elk, black bear, coyote, mountain lion, cottontails, jack rabbits, and various raptores.

A cool, mid-latitude steppe climate prevails. Annual precipitation of this elevation
range is between 7 and 10 inches. Temperatures range from 100°F in the summer to -40°F

in January. Paleoenvironmental data are scant, but it is generally agreed that gross climatic
conditions have remained fairly constant over the last 12,000 years. However, changes in
effective moisture, and cooling-warming trends probably affected the prehistoric occupation

of the region.

Files Search

Files searches were conducted through BLM and UDSH. Previous projects in the
areas near the inventory blocks and linear routes are numerous and generally relate to oil and

gas development. Those that are adjacent to the project areas are discussed below.

Numerous projects have been completed in the Sections indicated in the Location of
Project portion of the report. Significant to this report are those projects shown on Figure I,
including: U80-AF-0516b, U81-NH-429, UOO-AY-319bs, UOO-AF-206b, U00-AF-576b,
and UOl-MQ-694b.Of those, U00-AY-319bs and UOO-AF-576bs cover the area for the
proposed pipeline route to the Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18. Also the existing road to the
Sheep Wash Fed. #43-25-9-18 has been inventoried by two projects: UOO-AF-206b and
U00-AF-576bs. Project UO1-MQ-694bincludes two 40-acre blocks that overlay two
portions of our project area: the proposed Fed. #23-19-9-19 and a nearby road/pipeline
segment. With the 40-acre block that includes the proposed Fed. #23-19-9-19, site
42UN2931 was previously recorded. Site 42UN1180 was recorded as part of project #U81-
NH-429, and occurs along the north border of the 10-acre study area for the Sheep Wash
Fed. #41-25-9-18. Both the previously recorded sites were relocated to determine their
relationship to the proposed actions.

Regional archaeological studies suggest nearly continuous human occupation of
northeastern Utah for the past 12,000 years. Evidence of the Paleoindian Tradition, the
Archaic Tradition, Fremont Culture, and Protohistoric/Historic Utes has been found.
Historic records suggest occupation or use by EuroAmerican trappers, settlers, miners, and
ranchers as well. Overviews of the prehistory and history of the region are provided in the
Utah BLM Cultural Resource Series No. 11, Archaeological Inventory in the Seep Ridge
Cultural Study Tract, Uintah County, Northeastern Utah with a Regional Predictive Model
for Site Locations (Chandler and Larralde 1980), and in Cultural Resources Existing Data
Inventorv Vernal District, Utah (Jones and Mackay 1980).



Study Objectives

The purpose of the study was to identify and record all cultural resources within the
areas of potential impact and to assess their significance and eligibility to the National
Register of Historic Places (NRHP). The statements of significance included in this report

are field assessments made in support of recommendations to the BLM and State Historic
Preservation Officer (SHPO), and the final determination of site significance is made by the

BLM in consultation with the SHPO.

Paleontological resources were also considered in the inspection. However, a final
evaluation of those resources must be provided by a paleontologist permitted by Utah.

Field Methods

A Class IH, 100% pedestrian, cultural resources survey of the proposed well

locations was made by walking a series of concentric circles around the flagged centers to
diameters of 750 feet. The related access and pipeline routes not included within the 10-acre

study plots or the previous survey areas were surveyed by walking four parallel transects
spaced at 15m intervals and centered on the flagged lines to cover corridors 200 feet wide.

Cultural resources were sought as surface exposures and were characterized as sites
or isolated finds. Sites were defined by the presence of six or more artifacts and/or
significant feature(s) indicative of patterned human activity. Isolated finds were defined by
the presence of 1 to 5 artifacts apparently of surficial nature. Cultural resources encountered
were to be recorded to standards set by the Utah Division of State History (UDSH).

The basic approach to the data collection was the continuous mapping of observed

artifacts and features by recording UTM coordinates (NAD 83 Datum) using a Trimble Geo

XT. Site maps were created using corrected data and ARCMAP. Photographs were to be

taken at each site and to include general views and specific artifacts or features. Field notes

and photo negatives are filed at Grand River Institute, while the photographs are submitted

to the BLM and UDSH. No artifacts were collected.

Study Findings

As expected, cultural resources were encountered during the survey. Two isolated

finds and three sites (42UN4790, 42UN4791 and 42UN4792) were newly recorded. Two

previously recorded sites (42UN1180 and 42UN2931) were revisited to ascertain their

relationship to the proposed well locations. No paleontological resources were found. This

portion of the report presents a discussion of site significance evaluation, describes the sites

and provides their field evaluations. Appendix A contains the resources' location data and

the IMACS site forms.
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Site Significance

The National Historic Preservation Act of 1966 (NHPA) directs federal agencies to
ensure that federally-initiated or authorized actions do not inadvertently disturb or destroy
significant cultural resource values. Significance is a quality of cultural resource properties
that qualifies them for inclusion in the NRHP. The statements of significance included in
this report are field assessments to support recommendations to the BLM and State Historic
Preservation Officer (SHPO). The final determination of site sigaificance is made by the
controlling agencies in consultation with the SHPO and the Keeper of the Register.

The Code of Federal Regulations was used as a guide for the in-field site evaluations.
Titles 36 CFR 50, 36 CFR 800, and 36 CFR 64 are concerned with the concepts of
significance and (possible) historic value of cultural resources. Titles 36 CFR 65 and 36
CFR 66 provide standards for the conduct of significant and scientific data recovery
activities. Finally, Title 36 CFR 60.6 establishes the measure of significance that is critical
to the determination of a site's NRHP eligibility, which is used to assess a site's research
potential:

The quality of significance in American history, architecture, archaeology, and culture is
present in districts, sites, buildings, structures, and objects of State and local importance that
possess integrity of location, design, setting, materials, workmanship, feeling, and
association, and a) that are associated with events that have made a significant contribution
to the broad patterns of history; or b) that are associated with the lives of persons significant
in our past; or c) that embody the distinctive characteristics of a type, period, or method of
construction, or that represent the work of a master, or that possess high artistic values, or
that represent a significant and distinguishable entity whose components may lack
individual distinction; or d) that have yielded, or may be likely to yield, information
important in the prehistory or history.

Site Descriptions

Site 42UN1180 is an open lithic scatter previously recorded by Nickens and
Associates in 1981 as part of the Bonanza-Upalco Transmission Line portion of the Moon
Lake Transmission Lines Project (U81-NH-429). It was described as a thin scatter of
artifacts in a bowl-like feature and also a sandstone ridge comprising the north edge of the
bowl. A chalcedony corner-notched projectile point and a chert biface were recovered from
the site. This revisit located one projectile point tip and established GPS data for the sites
previously mapped topographic features.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
This site was previously evaluated as non-significant due to the apparent minimal

depth of cultural deposits and the lack of features. No change was made to that evaluation.

The site is presently north of the proposed impact area for the well location. No further
work is recommended.
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Site 42UN2931 is an open lithic scatter previously recorded by Montgomery
Archaeological Consultants in 2001 as part of the Phillip's Three Wells at Wilkin Ridge and
Riverbend Project (UO1-MQ-0694b).It was described as a lithic scatter dispersed
throughout a deflated aeolian dune area, with a few artifacts occurring on the dunes to either
side. A McKean lanceolate point, an Elko Earred point, and an Elko corner-notched point
were previously found at the site. This revisit relocated the established datum and found it
to be exactly where the previous GPS data had been plotted.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
This site was previously evaluated as significant due to its potential to yield

additional important information from likely buried deposits. No change was made to that
evaluation. The site lies southeast of the proposed impact area for the well location. No
further work is recommended.

Site.42UN4790 is a prehistoric open camp located on the valley floor at the base of a
large sand dune. The sparse vegetation is desert shadscale and four-wing saltbush. The soil
on the site is hard-packed sand. The aspect is open and the elevation is 4720 feet.

The overall artifact distribution is located in an area measuring approximately 40
meters in diameter. The collection consists mainly of flakes but a few tools and one
groundstone item were also identified. The groundstone is a single cobble mano of meta-
sandstone. Two large utilized flakes and a large butchering tool were point plotted. Lithic
materials consist mainly of cherts, quartzites, and mudstones and number over 300. The
chert is Parachute Creek type, which often has a varnish patina. Such patination is an
indication of the relative age of the artifacts, as indicated from the study of the Pariette
Overlook Site by Hauck and Weder (1989:39-42), and suggest that these flakes may be of
Archaic Era or Paleoindian Era age. No hearth or architectural features were noted,
however, the presence of such is possible in the subsurface deposits of the sand dune south
of the surface artifacts.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
Given the likelihood of depth of cultural fill in the dunes to the south, the site is

considered significant and may contain additional important information regarding the
prehistory of the local region. The site is presently within the proposed impact area for the
well location. Avoidance is recommended.

Site 42UN4791 is a prehistoric semi-sheltered camp located at the base and on the
slope of a prominent bedrock outerop in an otherwise open, fairly level topography. The
vegetation is predominantly blackbrush in sandy, dune-like soil. Indian Ricegrass was also
noted. The site has a northeast aspect and a good view of the surrounding valley. Elevation
is 4820 feet.
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Measuring approximately 60 meters NW-SE by 30 meters NE-SW the site consists

of a Shoshonean knife base fragment, two manos, five cobbles (or fragments thereof), a
utilized flake, two flakes, and a collectors pile of 5+ flakes. A few of the cobbles have also

been utilized. The manos are all of meta-sandstone and the one at the southeast edge of the

site has a thumbhole ground in its surface. Lithic materials present are green siltstone, white

quartzite and black chalcedony ( Shoshonean knife). The small shelter portion of the site

did not yield artifactual material per se, but it is likely the shelter was occupied at times. No
hearth features were noted, however, the sandy soils appear deep and subsurface cultural

deposits are likely.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
Given the likelihood of depth of cultural fill on the north and east porions of the site,

it is considered significant and may contain additional important information regarding the
prehistory of the local region. Avoidance and preservation are recommended, and at this
time the site is presently avoided by the proposed project. Accordingly, no further work is
recommended.

Site 42UN4792 is a prehistoric sheltered camp located on the south side of a large,
prominent bedrock outcrop. Elevation averages 4820 feet and the sparse vegetation consists
of a few small blackbrush plants and native grasses. Soils are sandy and pebbly.

The site area is large, measuring 480 meters E-W by 130 meters N-S and extends

nearly the entire length of the south side of the bedrock exposure. Artifacts are distributed
along the face of the bedrock and down the fairly steep slope. Several portions of the rock
outcrop afford shelter although no thermal or architectural features were noted. Artifacts
consist of large cobbles (3), manos (2), choppers (3), a scraper, a hafted axe, a hammerstone,
large flakes (7) and a collector's pile (5 flakes). No diagnostic items were observed and this
may be due to local unauthorized collecting as evidenced by the collector's pile at the east

end of the site area. Subsurface cultural deposits are likely however.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
Given the likelihood of depth of cultural fill on the south side of the butte with the

sandy soils, it is considered significant and may contain additional important information
regarding the prehistory of the local region. Avoidance and preservation are recommended,
and at this time the site is presently avoided by the proposed project. Accordingly, no
further work is recommended.

Summary of Site Evaluations and Management Recommendations

The eligibility determination and consultation process is guided by Section 106 of the
NHPA (36 CFR 60, 63, and 800). inventory to identify, evaluate, and mitigate potential
effects to cultural resources affected by an undertaking is the first steg in the Section 106
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process. BLM actions cannot be authorized until the Section 106 process is completed (36
CFR 800.3). In brief, the inventory recorded two prehistoric lithic scatters and two isolated
finds.

As a result of the inventory, two isolated finds and three sites (42UN4790,
42UN4791 and 42UN4792) were recorded. Two previously recorded sites (42UN1180 and

42UN2931) were revisited. The newly recorded sites and 42UN2931 were field evaluated as
significant and eligible for listing on the National Register of Historic Places. Site
42UN1180 was previously evaluated as non-significant and no change was made to that
evaluation.

Site 42UN4790 is presently within the proposed impact area for the Fed. #41-30-9-

19 well location. It should be avoided. A 5-acre addition was inventoried west of the well's
original10-acre block survey area to allow for the well center's movement in that direction.

The remaining sites will be avoided, so no further work is recommended.
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GAS00
EnergyInc

Bureau of Land Management
vernal Field office
170 S. 500 E.
Vernal, UT 84078

Attn: Minerals

.Re: All wells
Uintah county, utah

Gentlemen:

This letter is to inform you that Permitco Inc. is
authorized to act as Agent and to sign documents on behalf of
(Company Name) when necessary for filing county, state and
federal permits including onshore order No. 1, Right of way
applications, etc., for the above mentioned well.

It should be understood that Permitco is acting as Agent
only in those matters stated above and is not responsible for
drilling, completion, production or compliance with regulations.

agt £½e , Le Ramera ONy (company Name)
agrees to accept fufT responsibility for opefations conducted in
order to drill, complete and produce the above-mentioned well.

Sincerely,

oþ . ngwell
operati
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DR)]UKSHEET
ArPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL-

APD RECEIVED: 05/23/2005 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-36740

WELL NAME: SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18

OPERATOR: GASCO PRODUCTION ( N2575 )

CONTACT: VENESSA LANGMACHER PHONE NUMBER: 303-857-9999

PROPOSED LOCATION:

NESW 25 090S 180E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SURFACE: 2052 FSL 1932 FWL .Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 2052 FSL 1932 FWL

UINTAH Engineering

8 MILE FLAT NORTH ( 590 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: U-9803

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal
LATITUDE: 40.00028

PROPOSED FORMATION: BLKHK

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.8438

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3.

Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit

(No. UT-1233 )
Potash (Y/N) 9 R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No.43-1723 )

al Drilling Unit
N RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No:
(Date: ) Eff Date:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:
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0 0 4
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

- State of Utah May 26, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director Gasco Production Company

8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Division of Englewood, CO 80112

Oil, Gas & Mining

JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director Re: Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18 Well, 2052' FSL, 1932' FWL, NE SW,

Sec. 25, T. 9 South, R. 18 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36740.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Acting Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone(801)538-5340•facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801)538-7458
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Operator: Gasco Production Company
Well Name & Number Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18

API Number: 43-047-36740
Lease: U-9803

Location: NE SW Sec. 25 T. 9 South R. 18 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion ofits analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the
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UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAUOFLANDMANAGEMENT

VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: GASCO Production Company Location: NESW, Sec 25, T9S, R18E

Well No: Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18 Lease No: UTU-9803

API No: 43-047-36740 Agreement: N/A

Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker Office: 435-781-4490 Cell: 435-828-4470

Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee Office: 435-781-4432 Cell: 435-828-7875

Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger Office: 435-781-4502 Cell: 435-828-3913

Environmental Scientist: Paul Buhler Office: 435-781-4475 Cell: 435-828-4029

Environmental Scientist: Karl Wright Office: 435-781-4484

Natural Resource Specialist: Holly Villa Office: 435-781-4404

Natural Resource Specialist: Melissa Hawk Office: 435-781-4476

After hours contact number: (435) 781-4513 FAX: (435) 781-4410

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR

FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

AIIlease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is

made with the applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application

for Permit to Drillincluding Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is

considered fullyresponsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD

must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion operations.

NOTIFICATIONREQUIREMENTS

Location Construction -

Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and

(NotifyKarlWright) access roads.

Location Completion Prior to moving on the drilling rig.

(Notify Karl Wright)

Spud Notice -

Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.

(Notify PE)

Casing String & Cementing -
Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and

(Notify Jamie Sparger) cementing all casing strings.

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.

(Notify Jamie Sparger)

First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or

(Notify PE) production resumes after well has been off production for

more than ninety (90)
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Fonn 3160-3
FORM APPROVED

(August 1999)
OMB No 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
U-9803

' 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER N/A

la. Type of Work: DRILL Q REENTER
7. If Unit or CA Agreement. Name and No.

N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.

b, Type of Well: 00 Well Gas Well Other Single Zone Multiple Zone SheepWash Federal#23-25-9-18

2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044 8 inverness DriveEast, Suite 100 9. Well No

Gasco Production Company Englewood,CO80112 /

3. Name of Agent 303-857-9999 14421County Road 10 / 10. Field Pool, or Exploratory

Permitco Inc. - Agent Fort Lupton, CO80621 Riverbend

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) l1. Sec., T., R., M,, or Blk, and Survey or Area

At surface 2052'FSLand 1932'FWL Section25,T9S-R18E

At proposed prod. zone NESW
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately24.6miles Southeast of Myton,UT Uintah UT

lb. Distance trom proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit <edicated to this well

location to nearest
property or lease line, ft

. - 1932'
(Also to nearest drig. umt line, ifany) 1400.1 40 Acres; NESW

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BlA Bond No. on file

to nearest well, dniling, completed,
applied for, on this lease, R Appf0X. 1Û$Û' 12,891' UT-1233

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4879' GL ASAP 35 Days

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on Nationa1Forest System Lands, i 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

6

authorized office.

Signature Name (Printed/Typed)
' Date

n
gg y Q¡) p Venessa Langmacher 5/19/2005

Authori ed Agentfor Gasco Production Company
A (Sig Name (Printed/T, ged oate

AssistantFi nager om° Og Gas

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable tAle hose rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to

conduct operations thereon.

Conditions of approvat if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false. fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

DNOFOIL,GAS&
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DNOFOIL,GAS&



Page 2 of 6
Well: Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18

1/26/2006

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL (COAs)

Surface Conditions of Approval or monitoringare listed in the Surface Use Plan of the APDs

• Within 90 calendar days of the approval date for this Application for Permit to Drill (APD),

the operator/\essee will submit to the Authorized Officer (AO), on Sundry Notice Form
3160-5, an Interim Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on well pads,

access roads, and pipelines. At a minimum,this will include the Best Management

Practice of the reshaping of the pad to the originalcontour to the extent possible; the
respreading of the top soil up to the rig anchor points; and, reseeding the area using
appropriate reclamation methods. The AO will provide written approval or concurrence
within 30 calendar days of receipt.

The interim seed mixfor reclamation willbe:

Crested Wheatgrass Agropyron cristatum 4 lbs. lacre

Western wheat grass Agropyron smithií 4 lbs. /acre

Needle and thread grass Stipa comata 4 lbs. /acre

• If paleontologic materials are uncovered during construction, the operator shall
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials and contact the
Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will be made by the AO as to what mitigation
will be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material.

• Following well plugging and abandonment, the location, access roads, pipelines, and
other facilities shall be reclaimed. AIIdisturbed surfaces shall be reshaped to
approximate the originalcontour; the top soil respread over the surface; and, the surface
revegetated. The surface of approved staging areas where construction activities did

not occur may require disking or rippingand
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Well: Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18

1/23/2006

DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

AII provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
1. None.

DRILLINGICOMPLETIONIPRODUCINGOPERATINGSTANDARDS
1. There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/orworkover

program as approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. AIIwells,

whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance

with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,

lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well. Any changes in

operation must have prior approval from the BLM,Vernal Field Office Petroleum

Engineers.

2. The spud date and time shall be reported orallyto Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding.

3. Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least

24 hours in advance of casinq cementinq operations and BOPE & casinq pressure

4. Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE)willremain in use untilthe well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls must remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all

times. Choke manifolds must be located outside of the rig substructure.

AIIBOPE components willbe inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in

the daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by

Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE

pressure tests must be performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and i by the
rig pumps. Test must be reported in the driller's log.

BOP drills must be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out

from under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas

Order No. 2.

Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set

and cemented in place.

No aggressive/fresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used withincasing.

5. All shows of fresh water and minerals will be reported and protected. A sample will be

taken of any water flows and a water analysis furnished the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All

oil and gas shows will be adequately tested for commercial possibilities, reported, and

protected.

6. No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or
workover equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended
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without prior approval of the BLM, Vernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended

for more than 30 days, prior approval of the BLM,Vernal Field Office must be obtained

and notificationgiven before resumption of operations.

7. Chronologic drilling progress reports must be filed directly with the BLM,Vernal Field

Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers

untilthe well is completed.

Any change in the program must be approved by the BLM, Vernal Field Office. "Sundry

Notices and Reports on Wells" (Form BLM3160-5) must be filed for all changes of plans

and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Emergency approval may be obtained orally,but such approval does not waive the

written report requirement. Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of

facilities, including roads, gathering lines, batteries, etc., which willresult in the
disturbance of new ground, will require the filing of a suitable plan pursuant to Onshore

Oil & Gas Order No. 1 of 43 CFR 3164.1 and prior approval by the BLM, Vernal Field

Office.

In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well must be reported on the "Monthly Report

of Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in

which operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically

plugged and abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals

Management Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-

525-7922 (303) 231-3650 for reporting information.

8. Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and

Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30

days after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in

accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all

other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or

completionoperations,willbe filed on BLMForm 3160-4. Submit with the well

completion report a geologic report including, at a minimum,formation tops, and a

summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys, sample descriptions, strip

logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if performed.

Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) willbe submitted only when requested by the BLM,

Vernal Field Office.

9. Alloff-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or comminglingon-lease or off-lease will

have prior written approval from the BLM,Vernal Field Office.

All measurement points shall be identified as point of sales or allocation for royalty

determination prior to the installation of facilities.

10. Oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The Field Office

Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration

and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be

submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the

API standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas
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Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30

days after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in

accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all

other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or

completionoperations,willbe filed on BLMForm 3160-4. Submit with the well

completion report a geologic report including, at a minimum,formation tops, and a

summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys, sample descriptions, strip

logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if performed.

Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) willbe submitted only when requested by the BLM,

Vernal Field Office.

9. Alloff-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or comminglingon-lease or off-lease will

have prior written approval from the BLM,Vernal Field Office.

All measurement points shall be identified as point of sales or allocation for royalty

determination prior to the installation of facilities.

10. Oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The Field Office

Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration

and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be

submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the

API standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas
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11. A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be

submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production,

whichever occurs first. AIIsite security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil& Gas

Order No. 3 shall be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon

storage tanks will be effectively sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil& Gas Order No.

3.

12. This APD is approved subject to the requirement that, should the well be successfully
completed for production, the BLM, Vernal Field office must be notifiedwhen it is placed

in a producing status. Such notification will be by written communication and must be

received in this office by not later than the fifth business day following the date on which

the well is placed on production. The notification shall provide, as a minimum,the
following informational items:

a. Operator name, address, and telephone number.

b. Well name and number.

c. Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

d. Date wellwas placed in a producing status (date of first production

for which royalty will be paid).

e. The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil,or crude oiland
casing head gas, or natural gas and entrained liquid
hydrocarbons).

f. The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well

is located; otherwise the non-Federal or non-indian land category,
i.e., State or private.

g. Unit agreement and / or participating area name and number, if

applicable.

h. Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

13. Any venting or flaring of gas will be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A

and needs prior approval from Field Office Petroleum Engineers.

14. All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL

3A willbe reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events as defined in NTL3A,

willbe reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days.

"Other than Major Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will

be reported on the Monthly Report of Operations and Production.

15. Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water

produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A

permanent disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the

end of this 90-day period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed

permanent disposal method shall be submitted along with any necessary water

analyses, as soon as possible, but no later than 45 days after the date of first
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Any method of disposal which has not been approved prior to the end of the authorized

90-day period will be considered as an Incident of Noncompliance and willbe grounds

for issuing a shut-in order untilan acceptable manner for disposing of said water is

provided and approved by this office.

16. Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field

Office Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging

of the well, in order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is

suspended or abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled.

The "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within

30 days after the actual plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of

cement in each, and amount of casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface
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FEB 23 2006 20:12 HP LASERJET 3200 P.2

STATEOF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Gasco Energy, Inc Operator Account Number: N 2575

Address: 8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100

Englewood

state Co g¡p 80112 Phone NumW (303)483-0044

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng
_

County
4304736740 Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18 NESW 25 9 18 Uintah

Action Code Current EntRy New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number

2/22/2006

E e

Comments: SpudWell CONFilENTIAL-y

Weil 2
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp RnB County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Estabilah new entity for new well (singlewellonly) Beverly Walker

B - Add new wellto existing entity(groupor unitwell) Na lease Print)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existingentity ( ; y ff A /

O - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
pignature~/

E - Other(Explainin 'comments'section) EngineeringTech 2/24/2006

FEB2 4

FEB 23 2006 20:12 HP LASERJET 3200 P.2

STATEOF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Gasco Energy, Inc Operator Account Number: N 2575

Address: 8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100

Englewood

state Co g¡p 80112 Phone NumW (303)483-0044

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng
_

County
4304736740 Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18 NESW 25 9 18 Uintah

Action Code Current EntRy New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number

2/22/2006

E e

Comments: SpudWell CONFilENTIAL-y

Weil 2
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp RnB County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Estabilah new entity for new well (singlewellonly) Beverly Walker

B - Add new wellto existing entity(groupor unitwell) Na lease Print)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existingentity ( ; y ff A /

O - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
pignature~/

E - Other(Explainin 'comments'section) EngineeringTech 2/24/2006

FEB2 4



GASC0A
EnergyV

RECE1VED

APRZ4 2006

DN.0F0\L,GAS&MINlNG

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attn: Carol Daniels

April 19, 2006

Dear Ms Daniels:

Gasco Production Company will soon be drilling the Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18,
NESW 25-9S-18E, Uintah County, Utah. The API Number for this well is 43-047-
36740.

Gasco wishes to keep all information on this well CONFIDENTIAL for as long a period
as possible.

Yours truly,

Robin Dean
Geological Manager
Gasco Energy, Inc.

GASCOEnergy, Inc.
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100 Tel: (303) 483-0044 Email: invest@gascoenergy.com
Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: (303) 483-0011 Website: www.gascoenergy.com AMEX:
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Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF TH E INTERIOR Expires Jnovember 30.2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-009803

Do not use thisform for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. Ifindian_AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned weit Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals- NA

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement. Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Otfrer¡nstructions on reverse side

¡. Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36740
8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Fooiage. Sec.. T. R.. M. or Survey Description) Riverbend

2O52' FSL & 1932' FWL I I. County or Parish, State

NE SW of Section 25-T9S-RI SE
Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATlJRE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize O Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-OIT
Alter Casing O Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Q Recomplete Other NPUU IS'UII
Change Plans Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon

O Final Abandonment Notice Convert to hijection Plug Back O Water Disposal

13 Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or ocomplete horizontally. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the lšond under which the work will be performed or provide the Rond No on Ille with 131 M/f3IA. Required subsequent oports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Fomi 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements. including reclamation, have been completed. and the operator has
determined that the site isready for final inspection

This well was spud on 2/22/2006

RECEWED
APR262006

DIVOFOILGASAM
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed/7p ed) Title

LWalker Engineering Technician
Signature Date

April 24, 2000
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Tiile Date

( oÃltio; ppro 1 ifar ar atta ied Approval of tilis ex>tice dt>es not warrant or Office
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those ngIls in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section l001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instruenons on
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GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE #40112 T'0¶5 X/df--S -49-4 a -of;10m

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: BOP TEST Date: 5/1/06 Days:

Depth: Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation:

DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $19,423 CWC: $356,867
Contracto : NA3ORS RIG 611 Mud co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 16,650

Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tim a Break Do ¿n: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

06:00 09:00 3:00 MOVE IN RIG UP ROTARY TOOLS. Misc.ILabor: $ -

09:00 09:30 0:30 RAISE DERRICK. csg.crew: $ -

09:30 20:00 10:30 RIG UP. Daily Total: $ 19,423

20:00 24:00 4:00 PRESSURE TEST BOP cum.Wtr: $ -

UPPER KELLY VALVE - FAILED TO TEST (NEW VALVEIS ON SITE). Cum. Fuel $ -

LOWERKELLY VALVE - TESTED TO 5000 &250 PSI. Cum. Bits: $ -

INSIDE BOP - TESTED TO 5000 &250 PSI. BHA

SAFETY VALVE - TESTED TO 5000 & 250 PSI.

PIPE RAMS&INSIDEVALVE- TESTED TO 5000 & 250 PSI.

PIPE RAMS&OUTSIDEVALVE- TESTED TO 5000 &250 PSt.

ANNULAR PREVENTER - TESTED TO 2500 & 250 PSI.

PIPE RAMS,CHOKE LINE AND INSIDE MANIFOLD VALVES - TESTED TO 2500 & 250 F 31.

BLINDRAMS,KILL LINE, CHOKE LINE &MANIFOLD - TEST FAILED, WELLHEAD

INC DRLGFLANGE LOCK DOWN RINGSHEARED, VENDOR INSPECTION

RECOMMNEDEDTO CHANGE OUT DRLG FLANGE.

24:00 06:00 6:00 CHANGE OUT DRLG FLANGE. TOTAL BHA = 0.00

Survey

24.00 survey
PU LITH: BKG GAS

SO FLARE: CONN GAS

ROT LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 353T K.B. PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP
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GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE # 40112
¯7~'d '7S /6'E ofs f.ywp...>Ø

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLGCMT Date: 5/2/06 Days:

Depth: 3537' Prog: 0 D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: DRLGCMT

DMC: $2,100 TMC: $0 TDC: $52,933 CWC: $429,223

Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: W #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: A SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: T #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: E SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: R GPM : SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: 16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 21,500

Sand: AVDP: Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.5 JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 7000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 200 SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LTT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time 3reak D >wn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,100

06:00 14:00 8:00 CHANGE OUT WELLHEAD INC DRLG FLANGE. Misc.ILabor: $ 2,960

14:00 18:00 4:00 PRESSURE TEST UPPER KELLYVALVE,BLIND RAMS, cag.crew: $ 4,250

KILLLINE,CHOKE LINE & MANIFOLDTO 5000 &250 PSI, Daily Total: $ 52,933

SURFACE CSG TO 2500 &250 PSI, INSTALL WEAR BUSHING. cum.wtr: $ -

18:00 19:30 1:30 RU FRANKS WESTSTATES LD EQUIPMENT. Cum. Fuel $ 21,500

19:30 01:00 5:30 PU BHA AND DP, TAG CMT TOP @3425'. Cum. Bits: $ -

01:00 02:00 1:00 RD FRANKSWESTSTATES. BHA

02:00 04:00 2:00 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER, TIGHTEN KELLY. 7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

04:00 06:00 2:00 DRLG CMT 3424' - 3473'. .13 MM 1 33.03
IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey

24.00 Survey

PIU LITH: BKG GAS

S/O FLARE: CONN GAS

ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 353T K.B. PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 8077 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE # 40112
¯7~'d '7S /6'E ofs f.ywp...>Ø

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLGCMT Date: 5/2/06 Days:

Depth: 3537' Prog: 0 D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: DRLGCMT

DMC: $2,100 TMC: $0 TDC: $52,933 CWC: $429,223

Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: W #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: A SPM: Size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: T #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: E SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: R GPM : SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: 16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 21,500

Sand: AVDP: Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.5 JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 7000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 200 SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LTT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time 3reak D >wn: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,100

06:00 14:00 8:00 CHANGE OUT WELLHEAD INC DRLG FLANGE. Misc.ILabor: $ 2,960

14:00 18:00 4:00 PRESSURE TEST UPPER KELLYVALVE,BLIND RAMS, cag.crew: $ 4,250

KILLLINE,CHOKE LINE & MANIFOLDTO 5000 &250 PSI, Daily Total: $ 52,933

SURFACE CSG TO 2500 &250 PSI, INSTALL WEAR BUSHING. cum.wtr: $ -

18:00 19:30 1:30 RU FRANKS WESTSTATES LD EQUIPMENT. Cum. Fuel $ 21,500

19:30 01:00 5:30 PU BHA AND DP, TAG CMT TOP @3425'. Cum. Bits: $ -

01:00 02:00 1:00 RD FRANKSWESTSTATES. BHA

02:00 04:00 2:00 INSTALL ROTATING HEAD RUBBER, TIGHTEN KELLY. 7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

04:00 06:00 2:00 DRLG CMT 3424' - 3473'. .13 MM 1 33.03
IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey

24.00 Survey

PIU LITH: BKG GAS

S/O FLARE: CONN GAS

ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 353T K.B. PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: 8077 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE #40112 o7.5 / /65 5 Jt?Ÿ¾30V2
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/3/06 Days: 1

Depth: 4935' Prog: 1398 D Hrs: 20 AV RoP: 69.9 Formation: UINTA

DMC: $2,646 TMC: $2,100 TDC: $38,769 CWC: $467,992
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: W #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: A SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surr.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: T #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: E SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: R GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,500

Cake: Press: 968 Jets: 16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,300

Solids: AV DP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 11.0 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 1398 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 20 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 8000 SPR #1 : 54-200 FPH: 69.9 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000

ca : 100 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 300

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 17 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tirra Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,646

06:00 08:00 2:00 DRLG CMT 3473' - 3537'. Misc. I Labor: $ 900

8:00 09:00 1:00 DRLG 3537' - 3633' (96', 96 FPH). cag. crew: $ -

09:00 10:00 1:00 CIRC SURVEY - PRESSURE TEST CSG TO 500 PSI (15 MIN). Daily Total: $ 38,769

10:00 11:30 1:30 DRLG 3633' - 3665' (32', 21.3 FPH). Cum. Wtr: $ 2,300

11:30 12:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cum.Fuel $ 21,500

12:00 19:00 7:00 DRLG 3665' - 4142' (477', 68.0 FPH). cum.Bits: $ 9,000

19:00 19:30 0:30 CIRC SURVEY. BHA

19:30 06:00 10:30 DRLG 4142' - 4935' (793', 75.5 FPH). 7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03

IBs 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08
IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 3° 3600'

24.00 Survey 3 3/4° 4100'

P/U 125 LITH: BKG GAS

SIO 115 FLARE: CONN GAS

ROT. 120 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 718 On Hand: 7359 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE #40112 o7.5 / /65 5 Jt?Ÿ¾30V2
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/3/06 Days: 1

Depth: 4935' Prog: 1398 D Hrs: 20 AV RoP: 69.9 Formation: UINTA

DMC: $2,646 TMC: $2,100 TDC: $38,769 CWC: $467,992
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: W #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: A SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surr.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: T #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: E SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: R GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,500

Cake: Press: 968 Jets: 16'S Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,300

Solids: AV DP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 11.0 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 1398 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 20 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 8000 SPR #1 : 54-200 FPH: 69.9 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000

ca : 100 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 300

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 17 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tirra Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,646

06:00 08:00 2:00 DRLG CMT 3473' - 3537'. Misc. I Labor: $ 900

8:00 09:00 1:00 DRLG 3537' - 3633' (96', 96 FPH). cag. crew: $ -

09:00 10:00 1:00 CIRC SURVEY - PRESSURE TEST CSG TO 500 PSI (15 MIN). Daily Total: $ 38,769

10:00 11:30 1:30 DRLG 3633' - 3665' (32', 21.3 FPH). Cum. Wtr: $ 2,300

11:30 12:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cum.Fuel $ 21,500

12:00 19:00 7:00 DRLG 3665' - 4142' (477', 68.0 FPH). cum.Bits: $ 9,000

19:00 19:30 0:30 CIRC SURVEY. BHA

19:30 06:00 10:30 DRLG 4142' - 4935' (793', 75.5 FPH). 7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03

IBs 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08
IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 3° 3600'

24.00 Survey 3 3/4° 4100'

P/U 125 LITH: BKG GAS

SIO 115 FLARE: CONN GAS

ROT. 120 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 718 On Hand: 7359 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE # 40112 a ¶s /¶Æ S'~K †'3-aly'&3Og
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/4/06 Days: 2

Depth: 6372' Prog: 1437 |D Hrs: 22.50 AV ROP: 63.9 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $8,276 TMC: $13,023 TDC: $33,349 CWC: $503,041

Contracto : NABORSDRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: W #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: A SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: T #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: E SPM: MFG: STC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: R GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 700

Cake: Press: 968 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AVDP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 11.0 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 2835 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 42.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 8200 SPR #1 : 59-180 FPH: 66.7 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,250

Dapp ppb: 5.0 Btm.Up: 25 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tin-e Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 42.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 8,276

06:00 10:00 4:00 DRLG 4935' - 5159' (224', 56 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

10:00 11:00 1:00 CIRC SURVEY,RIG SERVICE,TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. Csg. Crew: $ -

11:00 01:30 14:30 DRLG 5159' - 6149' (990', 68.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 33,349

01:30 02:00 0:30 CIRC SURVEY. cum.wtr: $ 2,300

02:00 06:00 4:00 DRLG 6149' - 6372' (223', 55.8 FPH). cum.Fuel $ 21,500
cum.sits: $ 9,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

.13 MM 1 33.03

IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/4° 5127'

24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 6101'

P/U 140 LITH: BKG GA' 8

SIO 120 FLARE: CONN G. 14

ROT. 130 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3537' K.B. PEAK G) 74

FUEL Used: 1017 On Hand: 6342 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GA

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE # 40112 a ¶s /¶Æ S'~K †'3-aly'&3Og
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/4/06 Days: 2

Depth: 6372' Prog: 1437 |D Hrs: 22.50 AV ROP: 63.9 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $8,276 TMC: $13,023 TDC: $33,349 CWC: $503,041

Contracto : NABORSDRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: W #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: A SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: T #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: E SPM: MFG: STC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: R GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 700

Cake: Press: 968 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AVDP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 11.0 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 2835 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 42.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 8200 SPR #1 : 59-180 FPH: 66.7 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,250

Dapp ppb: 5.0 Btm.Up: 25 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tin-e Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 42.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 8,276

06:00 10:00 4:00 DRLG 4935' - 5159' (224', 56 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

10:00 11:00 1:00 CIRC SURVEY,RIG SERVICE,TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. Csg. Crew: $ -

11:00 01:30 14:30 DRLG 5159' - 6149' (990', 68.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 33,349

01:30 02:00 0:30 CIRC SURVEY. cum.wtr: $ 2,300

02:00 06:00 4:00 DRLG 6149' - 6372' (223', 55.8 FPH). cum.Fuel $ 21,500
cum.sits: $ 9,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

.13 MM 1 33.03

IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/4° 5127'

24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 6101'

P/U 140 LITH: BKG GA' 8

SIO 120 FLARE: CONN G. 14

ROT. 130 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3537' K.B. PEAK G) 74

FUEL Used: 1017 On Hand: 6342 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GA



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE # 40112 pg g / (E 4-- C/>pfjL 3d pg
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/5/06 Days: 3

Depth: 7505' Prog: 1133 |D Hrs: 23.0 AV ROP: 49.3 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $338 TMC: $13,361 TDC: $24,761 CWC: $527,802
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: W #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: A SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PvivP: T #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: E SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: R GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: 968 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.5 Jetvel: 109 FTG: 3968 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 65.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 8000 sPR #1: 59-300 FPH: 60.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 200 SPR#2: WOB: 15-20 PumpingUT: $ - MudMotors: $ 2,300

Dapp ppb: 3.8 Btm.Up: 32 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tirra Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 65.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 338

06:00 10:00 4:00 DRLG 6372' - 6626' (254', 63.5 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL,PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

10:30 21:00 10:30 DRLG6626' - 7137' (511', 48.7 FPH). DailyTotal: $ 24,761

21:00 21:30 0:30 CIRC SURVEY. cum.wtr: $ 2,300

21:30 06:00 8:30 DRLG 7137' - 7505' (368', 48.7 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 21,500
cum.Bits: $ 9,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03

18s 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08
IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA= 601.43

Survey 2 1/4° 6101'

24.00 Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

PIU 175 LITH: BKG GAS 22

SIO 160 FLARE: CONN GAS 120

ROT. 170 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 184

FUEL Used: 790 On Hand: 5552 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE # 40112 pg g / (E 4-- C/>pfjL 3d pg
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/5/06 Days: 3

Depth: 7505' Prog: 1133 |D Hrs: 23.0 AV ROP: 49.3 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $338 TMC: $13,361 TDC: $24,761 CWC: $527,802
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: W #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: A SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PvivP: T #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: E SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: R GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: 968 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.5 Jetvel: 109 FTG: 3968 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 65.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 8000 sPR #1: 59-300 FPH: 60.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 200 SPR#2: WOB: 15-20 PumpingUT: $ - MudMotors: $ 2,300

Dapp ppb: 3.8 Btm.Up: 32 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tirra Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 65.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 338

06:00 10:00 4:00 DRLG 6372' - 6626' (254', 63.5 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL,PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

10:30 21:00 10:30 DRLG6626' - 7137' (511', 48.7 FPH). DailyTotal: $ 24,761

21:00 21:30 0:30 CIRC SURVEY. cum.wtr: $ 2,300

21:30 06:00 8:30 DRLG 7137' - 7505' (368', 48.7 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 21,500
cum.Bits: $ 9,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03

18s 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08
IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA= 601.43

Survey 2 1/4° 6101'

24.00 Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

PIU 175 LITH: BKG GAS 22

SIO 160 FLARE: CONN GAS 120

ROT. 170 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 184

FUEL Used: 790 On Hand: 5552 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE #40112 Q ¶3 g /6E ,85 ç†"À'50H
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/6/06 Days: 4

Depth: 8145' Prog: 640 |D Hrs: 22.5 AV ROP: 28.4 |Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $10,566 TMC: $23,928 TDC: $35,539 CWC: $563,341

Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLE FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

Mw: W #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: A SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PviyP: T #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: E SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: R GPM: 401 SIN: JW6129 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: 968 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.5 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 4608 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 88.Û Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 8000 SPR #1 : 59-300 FPH: 52.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 200 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 Pumping LTT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,250

Dapp ppb: 3.8 Btm.Up: 36.5 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tima Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 88.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 10,566

06:00 13:00 7:00 DRLG 7505' - 7774' (269', 38.4 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ 600

13:00 13:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL,PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

13:30 06:00 16:30 DRLG 7774' - 8145' (371', 22.5 FPH). Daily Total: $ 35,539

cum.wtr: $ 2,300

MUD UP @8000'. Cum. Fuel $ 21,500
N°2 DW MOTOR FAILURE. Cum.Bits: $ 9,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03

IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/4° 6101'

24.00 survey 2 1/2° 7089'

P/U 175 LITH: BKG GAS 12

SlO 165 FLARE: CONN GAS 68

ROT. 170 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 353T K.B. PEAKGAS 40

FUEL Used: 931 On Hand: 4621 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE #40112 Q ¶3 g /6E ,85 ç†"À'50H
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/6/06 Days: 4

Depth: 8145' Prog: 640 |D Hrs: 22.5 AV ROP: 28.4 |Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $10,566 TMC: $23,928 TDC: $35,539 CWC: $563,341

Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLE FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

Mw: W #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: A SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PviyP: T #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: E SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: R GPM: 401 SIN: JW6129 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: 968 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: AV DP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.5 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 4608 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 88.Û Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 8000 SPR #1 : 59-300 FPH: 52.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 200 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 Pumping LTT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,250

Dapp ppb: 3.8 Btm.Up: 36.5 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tima Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 88.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 10,566

06:00 13:00 7:00 DRLG 7505' - 7774' (269', 38.4 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ 600

13:00 13:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL,PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

13:30 06:00 16:30 DRLG 7774' - 8145' (371', 22.5 FPH). Daily Total: $ 35,539

cum.wtr: $ 2,300

MUD UP @8000'. Cum. Fuel $ 21,500
N°2 DW MOTOR FAILURE. Cum.Bits: $ 9,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03

IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/4° 6101'

24.00 survey 2 1/2° 7089'

P/U 175 LITH: BKG GAS 12

SlO 165 FLARE: CONN GAS 68

ROT. 170 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 353T K.B. PEAKGAS 40

FUEL Used: 931 On Hand: 4621 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE#40112 TP¶¶ g/gg:J--gr gy SNgg
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/7/06 Days: 5

Depth: 8590' Prog: 445 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 18.9 |Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $7,988 TMC: $31,916 TDC: $108,961 CWC: $672,302
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLE FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 44 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surt.csg: $ - RigMove: $ 76,500

PVlYP: 15/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 14/22/26 SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 11 GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2/ Press: 968 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 2 AV DP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV Dc: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 5053' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 9.59 Hrs: 111.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 10000 SPR #1 : 54-410 FPH: 45.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 200 SPR #2: WOB: 15-20 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350

Dapp ppb: 7.0 Btm.Up: 36.5 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tirre Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 111.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 7,988

06:00 15:30 9:30 DRLG 8145' - 8309' (164', 17.3 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

15:30 16:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

16:00 06:00 14:00 DRLG 8309' - 8590' (281', 20.0 FPH). Daily Total: $ 108,961

cum.Wtr: $ 2,300
N°2 DW MOTOR FAILURE (ANTIFREEZE/DIESEL IN OIL). Cum. Fuel $ 21,500
N° 1 GENERATOR (HIGH OIL CONSUMPTION/OIL BLOWBY). Cum. Bits: $ 9,000

SURVEY MACHINE DEPTH COUNTER (FAILURE). BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

.13 MM 1 33.03

IBs 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/4° 6101'

24.00 Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

P/U 185 LITH: BKG GAS 9

SIO 170 FLARE: CONN GAS 114

ROT. 176 LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 119

FUEL Used: 1182 On Hand: 3439 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE#40112 TP¶¶ g/gg:J--gr gy SNgg
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/7/06 Days: 5

Depth: 8590' Prog: 445 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 18.9 |Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $7,988 TMC: $31,916 TDC: $108,961 CWC: $672,302
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLE FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 44 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surt.csg: $ - RigMove: $ 76,500

PVlYP: 15/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 14/22/26 SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 11 GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2/ Press: 968 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 2 AV DP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV Dc: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 5053' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 9.59 Hrs: 111.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 10000 SPR #1 : 54-410 FPH: 45.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 200 SPR #2: WOB: 15-20 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350

Dapp ppb: 7.0 Btm.Up: 36.5 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tirre Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 111.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 7,988

06:00 15:30 9:30 DRLG 8145' - 8309' (164', 17.3 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

15:30 16:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

16:00 06:00 14:00 DRLG 8309' - 8590' (281', 20.0 FPH). Daily Total: $ 108,961

cum.Wtr: $ 2,300
N°2 DW MOTOR FAILURE (ANTIFREEZE/DIESEL IN OIL). Cum. Fuel $ 21,500
N° 1 GENERATOR (HIGH OIL CONSUMPTION/OIL BLOWBY). Cum. Bits: $ 9,000

SURVEY MACHINE DEPTH COUNTER (FAILURE). BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

.13 MM 1 33.03

IBs 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/4° 6101'

24.00 Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

P/U 185 LITH: BKG GAS 9

SIO 170 FLARE: CONN GAS 114

ROT. 176 LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 119

FUEL Used: 1182 On Hand: 3439 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE # 40112 o ¶Sg /ff S çÿÿ 3gg
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/8/06 Days: 6

Depth: 8980' Prog: 390 D Hrs: 23.5 AV RoP: 16.6 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $2,108 TMC: $34,025 TDC: $26,581 CWC: $698,883
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLE FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 45 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619LSPX int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 14/22/25 SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 11 GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2/ Press: 1420 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 2 AV DP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.7 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 5443' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 9.78 Hrs: 135.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 10000 sPR #1: 54-500 FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 180 SPR#2: WOB: 15-20 PumpingLIT: $ - MudMotors: $ 2,350

Dapp ppb: 6.5 Btm.Up: 41.7 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tima Break Dot m: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 135.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,108

06:00 15:00 9:00 DRLG 8590' - 8812' (222', 24.7 FPH). Misc. / Labor: $ -

15:00 15:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL,PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cag. crew: $ -

15:30 06:00 14:30 DRLG 8812' - 8980' (168', 11.6 FPH). Daily Total: $ 26,581

cum.wtr: $ 2,300
Cum. Fuel $ 21,500
cum.Bits: $ 9,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

.13 MM 1 33.03

IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/4° 6101'

24.00 Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

PlU 195 LITH: BKG GAS 9

SIO 180 FLARE: CONN GAS 114

ROT. 185 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 119

FUEL Used: 635 On Hand: 2804 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE # 40112 o ¶Sg /ff S çÿÿ 3gg
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/8/06 Days: 6

Depth: 8980' Prog: 390 D Hrs: 23.5 AV RoP: 16.6 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $2,108 TMC: $34,025 TDC: $26,581 CWC: $698,883
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLE FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 45 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619LSPX int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 14/22/25 SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 11 GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2/ Press: 1420 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 2 AV DP: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.7 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 5443' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 9.78 Hrs: 135.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 10000 sPR #1: 54-500 FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 180 SPR#2: WOB: 15-20 PumpingLIT: $ - MudMotors: $ 2,350

Dapp ppb: 6.5 Btm.Up: 41.7 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tima Break Dot m: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 135.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,108

06:00 15:00 9:00 DRLG 8590' - 8812' (222', 24.7 FPH). Misc. / Labor: $ -

15:00 15:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL,PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cag. crew: $ -

15:30 06:00 14:30 DRLG 8812' - 8980' (168', 11.6 FPH). Daily Total: $ 26,581

cum.wtr: $ 2,300
Cum. Fuel $ 21,500
cum.Bits: $ 9,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

.13 MM 1 33.03

IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/4° 6101'

24.00 Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

PlU 195 LITH: BKG GAS 9

SIO 180 FLARE: CONN GAS 114

ROT. 185 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 119

FUEL Used: 635 On Hand: 2804 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE#40112 Tygg g/ S--g¶ C/>gg30ty

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: TRIP IN HOLE BIT N°2 Date: 5/9/06 Days: 7

Depth: 8990' Prog: 10 D Hrs: 1 AV ROP: 10.0 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $484 TMC: $34,509 TDC: $45,527 CWC: $744,410

Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 45 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PvivP: 13/21 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619LSPX Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 13/22/28 SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 11 GPM: 401 SIN: JW6129 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ 1,300

Cake: 2/ Press: 1420 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 420

Solids: 2 AV DP: 205 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 14,700

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 5453' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 9.81 Hrs: 136.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 9800 SPR #1 : 54-500 FPH: 40.1 Heater: $ - sits: $ -

ca : 160 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 100

Dapp ppb: 6.3 Btm.Up: 42.7 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 136.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 484

06:00 07:00 1:00 DRLG 8980' - 8990' (10', 10.0 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

7:00 07:30 0:30 PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY. csg. crew: $ 6,400

7:30 11:00 3:30 TRIP OUT W/ 35 STANDS DP. Daily Total: $ 45,527

11:00 13:00 2:00 RU LAYDOWN MACHINE. cum.wtr: $ 2,300

13:00 18:00 5:00 TRIP OUT (LD 157 JOINTS DRILL PIPE). Cum. Fuel $ 36,200

18:00 19:00 1:00 CHANGE OUT BHA. cum.Bits: $ 9,000

19:00 19:30 0:30 CHECK WEAR BUSHING - NO VISIBLE WEAR. BHA

19:30 01:00 5:30 TRIP IN W/ BIT N°2, (PU 157 JTS NEW HARDBAND DP). 7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

01:00 02:30 1:30 TRIP OUT TO SHOE, RD LAYDOWN MACHINE. .13 MM 1 33.03

02:30 06:00 3:30 SLIP AND CUT 250' DRLGLINE. IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

NABORS INSTRUCTED CREWS TO HAVE A SAFETY STAND DOWN AS IBS 1 4.42

A RESULT OF AN INCINDENT THAT OCCURRED ON ANOTHER RIG. 6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

(THIS INSTRUCTION ADDED 3 ADDITIONAL HOURS TO THE TRIP TIME ON RIG 611)

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

24.00 Survey 2 ° 8945'

PIU 195 LITH: BKG GAS

SIO 180 FLARE: CONN GAS

ROT. 185 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 900 On Hand: 6601 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE#40112 Tygg g/ S--g¶ C/>gg30ty

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: TRIP IN HOLE BIT N°2 Date: 5/9/06 Days: 7

Depth: 8990' Prog: 10 D Hrs: 1 AV ROP: 10.0 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $484 TMC: $34,509 TDC: $45,527 CWC: $744,410

Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 45 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PvivP: 13/21 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619LSPX Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 13/22/28 SPM: MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 11 GPM: 401 SIN: JW6129 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ 1,300

Cake: 2/ Press: 1420 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 420

Solids: 2 AV DP: 205 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 14,700

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 5453' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 9.81 Hrs: 136.0 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 9800 SPR #1 : 54-500 FPH: 40.1 Heater: $ - sits: $ -

ca : 160 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 100

Dapp ppb: 6.3 Btm.Up: 42.7 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 136.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 484

06:00 07:00 1:00 DRLG 8980' - 8990' (10', 10.0 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

7:00 07:30 0:30 PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY. csg. crew: $ 6,400

7:30 11:00 3:30 TRIP OUT W/ 35 STANDS DP. Daily Total: $ 45,527

11:00 13:00 2:00 RU LAYDOWN MACHINE. cum.wtr: $ 2,300

13:00 18:00 5:00 TRIP OUT (LD 157 JOINTS DRILL PIPE). Cum. Fuel $ 36,200

18:00 19:00 1:00 CHANGE OUT BHA. cum.Bits: $ 9,000

19:00 19:30 0:30 CHECK WEAR BUSHING - NO VISIBLE WEAR. BHA

19:30 01:00 5:30 TRIP IN W/ BIT N°2, (PU 157 JTS NEW HARDBAND DP). 7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

01:00 02:30 1:30 TRIP OUT TO SHOE, RD LAYDOWN MACHINE. .13 MM 1 33.03

02:30 06:00 3:30 SLIP AND CUT 250' DRLGLINE. IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

NABORS INSTRUCTED CREWS TO HAVE A SAFETY STAND DOWN AS IBS 1 4.42

A RESULT OF AN INCINDENT THAT OCCURRED ON ANOTHER RIG. 6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

(THIS INSTRUCTION ADDED 3 ADDITIONAL HOURS TO THE TRIP TIME ON RIG 611)

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

24.00 Survey 2 ° 8945'

PIU 195 LITH: BKG GAS

SIO 180 FLARE: CONN GAS

ROT. 185 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 900 On Hand: 6601 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE # 40112 TO YS p ¶ES OVA304†
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/10/06 Days: 8

Depth: 9415' Prog: 425 D Hrs: 18 AV ROP: 23.6 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $1,032 TMC: $35,541 TDC: $33,955 CWC: $778,365
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

Mw: 9.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 45 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" 7 7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PV/YP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619LSPX HC506Z Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 12/22/27 SPM: MFG: STC HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 12 GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 7006906 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1/ Press: 1420 Jets: 6-16 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 2 Av DP: 205 TD Out: 8990 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 8990 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.8 Jetvel: 109 FTG: 5453' 425' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 9.78 Hrs: 136.0 18 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 9800 sPR #1: 58-450 FPH: 40.1 23.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000

ca : 160 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,800

Dapp ppb: 8.0 stm.Up: 42.7 R-RPM: 50 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 154.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,032

06:00 08:30 2:30 TRIP IN W/ BIT N°2. Misc.lLabor: $ -

8:30 11:00 2:30 WASH AND REAM 8875' - 8990'. cag.crew: $ -

11:00 12:30 1:30 DRLG 8990' - 9022' (32', 21.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 33,955

12:30 13:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL,PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cum.wtr: $ 2,300

13:00 18:00 5:00 DRLG 9022' - 9135' (113', 22.6 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 36,200

18:00 18:30 0:30 RIG REPAIR - TIGHTEN DW DRUM BOLTS. cum.sits: $ 18,000

18:30 06:00 11:30 DRLG 9135' - 9415' (280', 24.3 FPH). BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03
IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08
IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

24.00 Survey 2 ° 8945'

P/U 200 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKG GAS 230

SIO 180 FLARE: CONN GAS 610

ROT. 187 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 610

FUEL Used: 917 On Hand: 5684 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE # 40112 TO YS p ¶ES OVA304†
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/10/06 Days: 8

Depth: 9415' Prog: 425 D Hrs: 18 AV ROP: 23.6 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $1,032 TMC: $35,541 TDC: $33,955 CWC: $778,365
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

Mw: 9.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 45 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" 7 7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PV/YP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: M619LSPX HC506Z Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 12/22/27 SPM: MFG: STC HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 12 GPM : 401 SIN: JW6129 7006906 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1/ Press: 1420 Jets: 6-16 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 2 Av DP: 205 TD Out: 8990 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 3537 8990 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.8 Jetvel: 109 FTG: 5453' 425' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 9.78 Hrs: 136.0 18 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 9800 sPR #1: 58-450 FPH: 40.1 23.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000

ca : 160 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,800

Dapp ppb: 8.0 stm.Up: 42.7 R-RPM: 50 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 154.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,032

06:00 08:30 2:30 TRIP IN W/ BIT N°2. Misc.lLabor: $ -

8:30 11:00 2:30 WASH AND REAM 8875' - 8990'. cag.crew: $ -

11:00 12:30 1:30 DRLG 8990' - 9022' (32', 21.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 33,955

12:30 13:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL,PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cum.wtr: $ 2,300

13:00 18:00 5:00 DRLG 9022' - 9135' (113', 22.6 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 36,200

18:00 18:30 0:30 RIG REPAIR - TIGHTEN DW DRUM BOLTS. cum.sits: $ 18,000

18:30 06:00 11:30 DRLG 9135' - 9415' (280', 24.3 FPH). BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03
IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08
IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

24.00 Survey 2 ° 8945'

P/U 200 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKG GAS 230

SIO 180 FLARE: CONN GAS 610

ROT. 187 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 610

FUEL Used: 917 On Hand: 5684 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy AFE #40117 ·¯/~pg g/g'g Sg J~O 2 309

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/11/06 Days: 9

Depth: 9915' Prog: 500 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 21.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,839 TMc: $38,381 TDC: $27,262 CWC: $805,627
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 47 SPM: 115 size: 7 7/8" surr.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 16/2 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 12/22/27 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 11 GPM: 401 SIN: 7006906 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1/ Press: 1420 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 2.3 AV DP: 205 TD: 9915 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 8990 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 925' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 10.13 Hrs: 41 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 9800 SPR #1 : 56-450 FPH: 22.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 160 SPR #2: WOB: 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,300

Dapp ppb: 7.0 Stm.Up: 45.7 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tirre Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 177.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,839

06:00 14:00 8:00 DRLG 9415' - 9623' (208', 24.5 FPH). Misc.I Labor: $ -

14:00 15:00 1:00 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL,PIPE RAMS AND HCR. csg.crew: $ -

15:00 18:00 3:00 DRLG 9623' - 9675' (52', 17.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 27,262

18:00 18:30 0:30 RIG REPAIR - INSTALL NEW DW AIR COMPRESSOR. cum.wtr: $ 2,300

18:30 06:00 11:30 DRLG 9675' - 9915' (240', 20.9 FPH). cum.Fuel $ 36,200
cum.Bits: $ 18,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03
IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08
IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

24.00 Survey 2 ° 8945'

PIU 210 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKG GAS 140

SIO 185 FLARE: CONN GAS 560

ROT. 195 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 560

FUEL Used: 1149 On Hand: 5684 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy AFE #40117 ·¯/~pg g/g'g Sg J~O 2 309

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/11/06 Days: 9

Depth: 9915' Prog: 500 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 21.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,839 TMc: $38,381 TDC: $27,262 CWC: $805,627
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 47 SPM: 115 size: 7 7/8" surr.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 16/2 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 12/22/27 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 11 GPM: 401 SIN: 7006906 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1/ Press: 1420 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 2.3 AV DP: 205 TD: 9915 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 8990 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 925' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 10.13 Hrs: 41 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 9800 SPR #1 : 56-450 FPH: 22.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 160 SPR #2: WOB: 15-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,300

Dapp ppb: 7.0 Stm.Up: 45.7 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tirre Break Doun: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 177.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,839

06:00 14:00 8:00 DRLG 9415' - 9623' (208', 24.5 FPH). Misc.I Labor: $ -

14:00 15:00 1:00 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL,PIPE RAMS AND HCR. csg.crew: $ -

15:00 18:00 3:00 DRLG 9623' - 9675' (52', 17.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 27,262

18:00 18:30 0:30 RIG REPAIR - INSTALL NEW DW AIR COMPRESSOR. cum.wtr: $ 2,300

18:30 06:00 11:30 DRLG 9675' - 9915' (240', 20.9 FPH). cum.Fuel $ 36,200
cum.Bits: $ 18,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03
IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08
IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

24.00 Survey 2 ° 8945'

PIU 210 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKG GAS 140

SIO 185 FLARE: CONN GAS 560

ROT. 195 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 560

FUEL Used: 1149 On Hand: 5684 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE #40117 70¶S P/gE S 345 59
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/12/06 Days: 10

Depth: 10201' Prog: 286 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 12.2 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $2,631 TMC: $41,012 TDC: $27,104 CWC: $832,731
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud co: MI DRLGFLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 44 SPM: 115 size: 7 7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 13/19 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 11/19/25 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 11 GPM : 401 SIN: 7006906 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1/ Press: 1581 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 8.6 AV DP: 205 TD: 10201' TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 8990 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.7 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 1211' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 10.15 Hrs: 64.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 11000 SPR #1 : 53-470 FPH: 18.Û Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 200 sPR#2: wos: 15-20 PumpingLIT: $ - MudMotors: $ 2,350

Dapp ppb: 7.0 Btm.Up: 47.9 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tin e Break Dot tn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 200.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,631

06:00 08:00 2:00 DRLG 9915' - 9973' (58', 29.0 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

8:00 08:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. csg.crew: $ -

8:30 06:00 21:30 DRLG 9973' - 10201' (228', 7.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 27,104

cum.wtr: $ 2,300
Cum. Fuel $ 36,200
cum.Bits: $ 18,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03

IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42
6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

24.00 Survey 2 ° 8945'

P/U 210 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKG GAS 400

SIO 190 FLARE: CONN GAS 760

ROT. 200 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 760

FUEL Used: 1005 On Hand: 3310 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE #40117 70¶S P/gE S 345 59
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/12/06 Days: 10

Depth: 10201' Prog: 286 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 12.2 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $2,631 TMC: $41,012 TDC: $27,104 CWC: $832,731
Contracto : NABORS DRLG Mud co: MI DRLGFLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 44 SPM: 115 size: 7 7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 13/19 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 11/19/25 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,873

WL: 11 GPM : 401 SIN: 7006906 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1/ Press: 1581 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 8.6 AV DP: 205 TD: 10201' TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 8990 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.7 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 1211' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 10.15 Hrs: 64.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 11000 SPR #1 : 53-470 FPH: 18.Û Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 200 sPR#2: wos: 15-20 PumpingLIT: $ - MudMotors: $ 2,350

Dapp ppb: 7.0 Btm.Up: 47.9 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tin e Break Dot tn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 200.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,631

06:00 08:00 2:00 DRLG 9915' - 9973' (58', 29.0 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

8:00 08:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. csg.crew: $ -

8:30 06:00 21:30 DRLG 9973' - 10201' (228', 7.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 27,104

cum.wtr: $ 2,300
Cum. Fuel $ 36,200
cum.Bits: $ 18,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03

IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08

IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 1/2° 7089'

24.00 Survey 2 ° 8945'

P/U 210 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKG GAS 400

SIO 190 FLARE: CONN GAS 760

ROT. 200 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 760

FUEL Used: 1005 On Hand: 3310 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT eggne rgy AFE # 40117 V3-0¥F- S Pfo
Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: TRIP OUT W/ BIT N°2 Date: 5/13/06 Days: 11

Depth: 10395' Prog: 194 |D Hrs: 16.0 Av RoP: 12.1 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $2,115 TMC: $43,127 TDC: $46,804 CWC: $879,535

Contracto : NABORS RIG 611 Mud Co: MI DRLGFLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 44 SPM: 115 size: 7 7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 10/18/24 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,699

WL: 11 GPM : 401 SIN: 7006906 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,940

Cake: 1/ Press: 1580 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 4,500

Solids: 9.4 AV DP: 205 TD: 10395' TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 14,700

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 8990 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 1405' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: ECD: 10.57 Hrs: 80.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 11000 sPR #1: 58-520 FPH: 17.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 180 SPR #2 : WOB: 20-25 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,600

Dapp ppb: 6.5 Btm.Up: 49.2 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tin e Break Do sn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 216.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,115

06:00 10:00 4:00 DRLG 10201' - 10258' (5T, 14.3 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. csg.crew: $ -

10:30 11:00 0:30 SAFETY STAND DOWN. Daily Total: $ 46,804

11:00 14:30 3:30 DRLG 10258' - 10323' (65', 18.6 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 12,362

14:30 16:00 1:30 WORK TIGHT CONNECTION, INCREASE MUD WEIGHT. cum.Fuel $ 50,900

16:00 0:30 8:30 DRLG 10323' - 10395' (72', 8.5 FPH). cum.sits: $ 18,000

0:30 01:30 1:00 CIRC, PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY. BHA

1:30 05:00 4:30 TRIP OUT W/ BIT 2. 7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03

IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08
IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 ° 8945'

24.00 Survey 3 ° 1034T

P/U 215 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKG GAS 310

S/O 195 FLARE: CONN GAS 490

ROT. 202 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 490

FUEL Used: 1081 On Hand: 6729 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY

E
DAILY DRILLING REPORT eggne rgy AFE # 40117 V3-0¥F- S Pfo

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: TRIP OUT W/ BIT N°2 Date: 5/13/06 Days: 11

Depth: 10395' Prog: 194 |D Hrs: 16.0 Av RoP: 12.1 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $2,115 TMC: $43,127 TDC: $46,804 CWC: $879,535

Contracto : NABORS RIG 611 Mud Co: MI DRLGFLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 44 SPM: 115 size: 7 7/8" surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 10/18/24 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,699

WL: 11 GPM : 401 SIN: 7006906 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,940

Cake: 1/ Press: 1580 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 4,500

Solids: 9.4 AV DP: 205 TD: 10395' TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 14,700

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 8990 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.8 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 1405' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: ECD: 10.57 Hrs: 80.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 11000 sPR #1: 58-520 FPH: 17.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 180 SPR #2 : WOB: 20-25 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,600

Dapp ppb: 6.5 Btm.Up: 49.2 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tin e Break Do sn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 216.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,115

06:00 10:00 4:00 DRLG 10201' - 10258' (5T, 14.3 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. csg.crew: $ -

10:30 11:00 0:30 SAFETY STAND DOWN. Daily Total: $ 46,804

11:00 14:30 3:30 DRLG 10258' - 10323' (65', 18.6 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 12,362

14:30 16:00 1:30 WORK TIGHT CONNECTION, INCREASE MUD WEIGHT. cum.Fuel $ 50,900

16:00 0:30 8:30 DRLG 10323' - 10395' (72', 8.5 FPH). cum.sits: $ 18,000

0:30 01:30 1:00 CIRC, PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY. BHA

1:30 05:00 4:30 TRIP OUT W/ BIT 2. 7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.03

IBS 1 6.60
6-1/2 DC 1 31.08
IBS 1 4.42

6-1/2 DC 17 525.30

TOTAL BHA = 601.43

Survey 2 ° 8945'

24.00 Survey 3 ° 1034T

P/U 215 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKG GAS 310

S/O 195 FLARE: CONN GAS 490

ROT. 202 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 490

FUEL Used: 1081 On Hand: 6729 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLING REPORT

Ener afs x im er
AFE #40117 C/ p oyo

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: TRIP OUT W/ BIT N°2 Date: 5/14/06 Days: 12

Depth: 10408' Prog: 13 |D Hrs: 3.0 Av RoP: 4.3 |Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $4,794 TMC: $47,921 TDC: $36,043 Cwc: $915,578
Contracto : NABORS RIG 611 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.2 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 3 4 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 46 SPM: 115 size: 7 7/8" 7 7/8 surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 15/22 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: K503BPX 506Z Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 12/19/25 SPM: MFG: STC HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,699

WL: 10 GPM : 401 SIN: JW5973 7205051 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1/ Press: 1580 Jets: TFA 1.20 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 9.5 AV DP: 205 TD: 10408' TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 10395 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.9 Jetvel: 109 FTG: 13' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 10.72 Hrs: 3 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 sPR#1: 58-520 FPH: 4.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000

ca : 120 SPR #2 : WOB: 10-12 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 300

Dapp ppb: 7.0 Btm.Up: 49.6 R-RPM: 400 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tin e Break Do vn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 56 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 219.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,794

06:00 07:30 1:30 TOOH W/ BIT N° 2. Misc. I Labor: $ -

7:30 08:00 0:30 INSPECT WEAR BUSHING - OK. cag.crew: $ -

8:00 13:30 5:30 TRIP IN W/ BIT N° 3. Daily Total: $ 36,043

13:30 16:00 2:30 WASH AND REAM 10300' - 10395'. cum.wtr: $ 12,362

16:00 19:00 3:00 DRLG10395' - 10408' (13', 4.3 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 50,900

19:00 01:30 6:30 TRIP OUT W/ BIT N° 3 (WET STRING). cum.sits: $ 27,000

1:30 03:00 1:30 CHANGE OUT BHA. BHA

3:00 06:00 3:00 TRIP IN W/ BIT 3. 7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 (STB) MM 1 32.96

NOTE: IBS 1 4.44

HUNTING MM POWER SECTION/BEARINGS FAILURE, 6-1/2 DC 18 554.38

PRESSURED UP ONIOFF BTM - PULLED WET STRING.

HUNTING HAD A BACK MM UP IN VERNAL, BUT JUST PRIOR TO

SENDING THE MOTOR OUT TO SITE REALIZED THE

STABILIZER OD WAS TOO LARGE TO RUN INTO7 7/8" HOLE.
TOTAL BHA = 592.78

Survey 2 ° 8945'

24.00 survey 3 ° 10347'

PIU 215 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKGGAS 370

SIO 195 FLARE: CONN GAS 370

ROT. 204 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 670

FUEL Used: 518 On Hand: 6211 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLING REPORT

Ener afs x im er
AFE #40117 C/ p oyo

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: TRIP OUT W/ BIT N°2 Date: 5/14/06 Days: 12

Depth: 10408' Prog: 13 |D Hrs: 3.0 Av RoP: 4.3 |Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $4,794 TMC: $47,921 TDC: $36,043 Cwc: $915,578
Contracto : NABORS RIG 611 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.2 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit#: 3 4 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 46 SPM: 115 size: 7 7/8" 7 7/8 surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 15/22 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: K503BPX 506Z Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 12/19/25 SPM: MFG: STC HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,699

WL: 10 GPM : 401 SIN: JW5973 7205051 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1/ Press: 1580 Jets: TFA 1.20 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 9.5 AV DP: 205 TD: 10408' TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth In: 10395 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.9 Jetvel: 109 FTG: 13' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 10.72 Hrs: 3 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 sPR#1: 58-520 FPH: 4.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000

ca : 120 SPR #2 : WOB: 10-12 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 300

Dapp ppb: 7.0 Btm.Up: 49.6 R-RPM: 400 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tin e Break Do vn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 56 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 219.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,794

06:00 07:30 1:30 TOOH W/ BIT N° 2. Misc. I Labor: $ -

7:30 08:00 0:30 INSPECT WEAR BUSHING - OK. cag.crew: $ -

8:00 13:30 5:30 TRIP IN W/ BIT N° 3. Daily Total: $ 36,043

13:30 16:00 2:30 WASH AND REAM 10300' - 10395'. cum.wtr: $ 12,362

16:00 19:00 3:00 DRLG10395' - 10408' (13', 4.3 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 50,900

19:00 01:30 6:30 TRIP OUT W/ BIT N° 3 (WET STRING). cum.sits: $ 27,000

1:30 03:00 1:30 CHANGE OUT BHA. BHA

3:00 06:00 3:00 TRIP IN W/ BIT 3. 7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00
.13 (STB) MM 1 32.96

NOTE: IBS 1 4.44

HUNTING MM POWER SECTION/BEARINGS FAILURE, 6-1/2 DC 18 554.38

PRESSURED UP ONIOFF BTM - PULLED WET STRING.

HUNTING HAD A BACK MM UP IN VERNAL, BUT JUST PRIOR TO

SENDING THE MOTOR OUT TO SITE REALIZED THE

STABILIZER OD WAS TOO LARGE TO RUN INTO7 7/8" HOLE.
TOTAL BHA = 592.78

Survey 2 ° 8945'

24.00 survey 3 ° 10347'

PIU 215 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKGGAS 370

SIO 195 FLARE: CONN GAS 370

ROT. 204 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3537' K.B. PEAK GAS 670

FUEL Used: 518 On Hand: 6211 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT .

Ener « « s s,
AFE #40117 -gr '3 o

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/15/06 Days: 13

Depth: 10697' Prog: 289 D Hrs: 17.5 AV ROP: 16.5 |Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $3,464 TMC: $51,383 TDC: $27,163 CWC: $942,741
Contracto : NABORS RIG 611 Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.2 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 44 SPM: 115 size: 7 7/8 surr.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 15/28 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: 506Z int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 11/20/27 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,699

WL: 10 GPM: 401 SIN: 7205051 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1/ Press: 1580 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 9.5 AV DP: 205 TD: 10697' TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth in: 10408' Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.6 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 289' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 10.86 Hrs: 17.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 11500 sPR#1: 54-500 FPH: 16.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 180 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,750

Dapp ppb: 6.7 Btm.Up: 49.8 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tin e Break Do-vn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 237.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,464

06:00 10:00 4:00 TRIP IN W/ BIT 3. Misc.ILabor: $ -

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. csg.crew: $ -

10:30 12:30 2:00 WASH AND REAM 10320' - 10408'. Daily Total: $ 27,163

12:30 06:00 17:30 DRLG 10408' - 10697' (289', 16.5 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 12,362
Cum. Fuel $ 50,900
cum.Bits: $ 27,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

.13 (STB) MM 1 32.96
IBS 1 4.44
6-1/2 DC 18 554.38

TOTAL BHA = 592.78

Survey 2 * 8945'

24.00 Survey 3 ° 10347'

PIU 220 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKG GAS 240

SIO 195 FLARE: CONN GAS 590

ROT. 209 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 353T K.B. PEAK GAS 590

FUEL Used: 945 On Hand: 5266 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT .

Ener « « s s,
AFE #40117 -gr '3 o

Well: SWF 23-25-9-18 Oper: DRLG Date: 5/15/06 Days: 13

Depth: 10697' Prog: 289 D Hrs: 17.5 AV ROP: 16.5 |Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $3,464 TMC: $51,383 TDC: $27,163 CWC: $942,741
Contracto : NABORS RIG 611 Mud Co: MI DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.2 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Loc Cost: $ -

vis: 44 SPM: 115 size: 7 7/8 surr.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 15/28 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: 506Z int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500

Gel: 11/20/27 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,699

WL: 10 GPM: 401 SIN: 7205051 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1/ Press: 1580 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 9.5 AV DP: 205 TD: 10697' TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DC: 337 Depth in: 10408' Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 7.6 Jetvei: 109 FTG: 289' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: 10.86 Hrs: 17.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 11500 sPR#1: 54-500 FPH: 16.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 180 SPR #2 : WOB: 15-20 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,750

Dapp ppb: 6.7 Btm.Up: 49.8 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Tin e Break Do-vn: Total D.T. M-RPM: 52 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 0.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 237.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,464

06:00 10:00 4:00 TRIP IN W/ BIT 3. Misc.ILabor: $ -

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE, TEST HYDRILL, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. csg.crew: $ -

10:30 12:30 2:00 WASH AND REAM 10320' - 10408'. Daily Total: $ 27,163

12:30 06:00 17:30 DRLG 10408' - 10697' (289', 16.5 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 12,362
Cum. Fuel $ 50,900
cum.Bits: $ 27,000

BHA
7-7/8" BIT 1 1.00

.13 (STB) MM 1 32.96
IBS 1 4.44
6-1/2 DC 18 554.38

TOTAL BHA = 592.78

Survey 2 * 8945'

24.00 Survey 3 ° 10347'

PIU 220 LITH: 60% SH, 30% SD, 10% SLT. BKG GAS 240

SIO 195 FLARE: CONN GAS 590

ROT. 209 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 353T K.B. PEAK GAS 590

FUEL Used: 945 On Hand: 5266 Co.Man J DUNCAN TRIP GAS



Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-19' gygg - 36'7VO

6/16/06 Rig up Black Warrior and run CCL/ Gamma Ray/ Bond log. Log shows
cement to 3000' w/ poor bond above 5250'. DC $ 9233 (CR)

6/23/06 Rig up B & C Quicktest and pressure test well to 9500 psi. Held pressure
for 15 min, tested good. (CR)

Completion- 1" l\1obe- Spring Canyon

6/28/06 Rig up Black Warrior and RIH w/ 3 ¼ guns and perf Spring Canyon (a
12,545-52' w/ 3 SPF @120° Spacing . RDMO wireline. (CR) DC $
l1,374 CCC $ 20,607

RECEIVED
JUN28 2006

DN.OFOIL,GAS&

Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-19' gygg - 36'7VO

6/16/06 Rig up Black Warrior and run CCL/ Gamma Ray/ Bond log. Log shows
cement to 3000' w/ poor bond above 5250'. DC $ 9233 (CR)

6/23/06 Rig up B & C Quicktest and pressure test well to 9500 psi. Held pressure
for 15 min, tested good. (CR)

Completion- 1" l\1obe- Spring Canyon

6/28/06 Rig up Black Warrior and RIH w/ 3 ¼ guns and perf Spring Canyon (a
12,545-52' w/ 3 SPF @120° Spacing . RDMO wireline. (CR) DC $
l1,374 CCC $ 20,607

RECEIVED
JUN28 2006

DN.OFOIL,GAS&



Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18 Ys- 42- as ? Fa

6/16/06 Rig up Black Warrior and run CCL/ Gamma Ray/ Bond log. Log shows
cement to 3000' w/ poor bond above 5250'. DC $ 9233 (CR)

6/23/06 Rig up B & C Quicktest and pressure test well to 9500 psi. Held pressure
for 15 min, tested good. (CR)

Completion- 1" Mohe- Spring Canyon

6/28/06 Rig up Black Warrior and RIH w/ 3 ½ guns and perf Spring Canyon (a
12,545-52' w/ 3 SPF @120° Spacing . RDMO wireline. (CR) DC $
11,374 CCC $ 20,607

6/29/06 MIRU Superior Well Serv. (Paul and Kevin treating). Test lines to 9500
psi. Found 2810 psi SICP. Broke dn perfs @6200 psi @5 bpm. ISIP
5650. FG .89. Calc 12 holes open / 21. Gel fraced Spring Canyon Stg 1
w/ 91300# 20-40 Versaprop and 48000# 20-40 Magnaprop, using 2406
bbls 25 and 20# Borate XL gel. Screened out with 142 bbls flush away
(45 bbls short) to 8500 psi. ISIP N/A. Left 6800# sd in csg. Opened well
to flowback @12:15 PM w/ 7000 psi SICP on 10/64" ck. Well flg
7:00AM @2450 FCP on 14/64" ck. TR 603 in 18 ¾ hrs. BLWTR 1803.
Making 5-6 bph. Will go dn line as soon as sand trap installed, this AM.
(SCE) (SCE) DC $148,587 CCC $169,194

6/30/06 Put well dn line @10:00AM 6/29/06. Making 930 MCFD rate w/ 3300
FCP, on 12/64" ck. TR 619. BLWTR 1787. Final Report. (SCE)

RECENED

JULO3 2006

DKOF0\L,GAS&

Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18 Ys- 42- as ? Fa

6/16/06 Rig up Black Warrior and run CCL/ Gamma Ray/ Bond log. Log shows
cement to 3000' w/ poor bond above 5250'. DC $ 9233 (CR)

6/23/06 Rig up B & C Quicktest and pressure test well to 9500 psi. Held pressure
for 15 min, tested good. (CR)

Completion- 1" Mohe- Spring Canyon

6/28/06 Rig up Black Warrior and RIH w/ 3 ½ guns and perf Spring Canyon (a
12,545-52' w/ 3 SPF @120° Spacing . RDMO wireline. (CR) DC $
11,374 CCC $ 20,607

6/29/06 MIRU Superior Well Serv. (Paul and Kevin treating). Test lines to 9500
psi. Found 2810 psi SICP. Broke dn perfs @6200 psi @5 bpm. ISIP
5650. FG .89. Calc 12 holes open / 21. Gel fraced Spring Canyon Stg 1
w/ 91300# 20-40 Versaprop and 48000# 20-40 Magnaprop, using 2406
bbls 25 and 20# Borate XL gel. Screened out with 142 bbls flush away
(45 bbls short) to 8500 psi. ISIP N/A. Left 6800# sd in csg. Opened well
to flowback @12:15 PM w/ 7000 psi SICP on 10/64" ck. Well flg
7:00AM @2450 FCP on 14/64" ck. TR 603 in 18 ¾ hrs. BLWTR 1803.
Making 5-6 bph. Will go dn line as soon as sand trap installed, this AM.
(SCE) (SCE) DC $148,587 CCC $169,194

6/30/06 Put well dn line @10:00AM 6/29/06. Making 930 MCFD rate w/ 3300
FCP, on 12/64" ck. TR 619. BLWTR 1787. Final Report. (SCE)

RECENED

JULO3 2006

DKOF0\L,GAS&



Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March]I,2007

5 Lease Serial No,
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enteran 6 If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned weH. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

l. Type of Well

Oil well Gas Well Other 8 Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9- I8
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 043-047-36740
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 1I2 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage, Sec
,

T. R. M. or Survey I>escriptum) Riverbend
I 1. County or Parish, State

2052' FSL & 1932' FWL NE SW of Section 25-T9S-RI8E
.

Utntah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inten: Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Allermg Casing Fracture Treal Reclamation Well Integrily

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Conven to Injeciion Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
if the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond unda which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved opemtions. If the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Forn 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Noliœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the opemlor has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

This is to inform you that we will be disposing of water from this well as follows:

All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
Brennan bottom Water Disposal located between Roosevelt and Vernal Utah.
A copy of their permit is attached for your records.

RECEIVED
JULO52006

14 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
DIVOFOli GAS&MINING

Name (Prmted 7pped)
Title

Beverly Wallpef Engineering Technician

Signattr Date
June 30, 2006

THIS SP E FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S C Section 1212, make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its gunsdiction.

(Instructions on page
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Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18

6/16/06 Rig up Black Warrior and run CCL/ Gamma Ray/ Bond log. Log shows
cement to 3000' w/ poor bond above 5250'. DC $ 9233 (CR)

6/23/06 Rig up B & C Quicktest and pressure test well to 9500 psi. Held pressure
for 15 min, tested good. (CR)

Completion- 1" Mobe- Spring Canyon

6/28/06 Rig up Black Warrior and RIH w/ 3 ¼ guns and perf Spring Canyon @
12,545-52' w/ 3 SPF @120°Spacing . RDMO wireline. (CR) DC $
l1,374 CCC $ 20,607

6/29/06 MIRU Superior Well Serv. (Paul and Kevin treating). Test lines to 9500
psi. Found 2810 psi SICP. Broke dn perfs @6200 psi @5 bpm. ISIP
5650. FG .89. Calc 12 holes open / 21. Gel fraced Spring Canyon Stg 1
w/ 91300# 20-40 Versaprop and 48000# 20-40 Magnaprop, using 2406
bbls 25 and 20# Borate XL gel. Screened out with 142 bbls flush away
(45 bbls short) to 8500 psi. ISIP N/A. Left 6800# sd in csg. Opened well
to flowback @12:15 PM w/ 7000 psi SICP on 10/64" ck. Well flg
7:00AM @2450 FCP on 14/64" ck. TR 603 in 18 ¾ hrs. BLWTR 1803.
Making 5-6 bph. Will go dn line as soon as sand trap installed, this AM.
(SCE) (SCE) DC $148,587 CCC $169,194

6/30/06 Put well dn line @10:00AM 6/29/06. Making 930 MCFD rate w/ 3300
FCP, on 12/64" ck. TR 619. BLWTR 1787. Final Report. (SCE)

Completion- 2ndMobe- Desert/Grassy, MvL

7/11/06 MIRU Superior and Black Warrior Wireline. RIH w/ Magnum 10K CBP
and guns to perf Stg 2 - Desert / Grassy. While running in hole, tools
stacked out @3260' +- (in sand bridge). Stuck. Opened well up on 12
and 14/64" ck. Tools came free and moved up hole to 3204' and stuck
again. Continued to flow well. No success getting tools free. Pumped
2% Kcl dn csg, staging in hole very slowly, w/ 47 bbls. No success.
Flowed 47 bb1sback, slowly at first, then harder. No success. Pumped dn
hole w/ 55 bbls (7 bbls more than csg cap @plug) w/ no success. Flowed
55 bb1sback. Tried to fire plug and set. Shorted. Had to pull out of rope
socket, leaving entire gun assy in hole @3204' (plug depth), w/ no cable
above rope socket . OAL of fish = 29.5'. Rope socket OD = 1 7/16" x
10 5/8" (w/ 1" tip). CCL OD 3.125" x 20 5/8". Guns OD = 3 3/8"
(scalloped and live)x 14'. Baker 10 setting tool and sleeve max OD =

RECEIVED

AU60 3 2006
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18

6/16/06 Rig up Black Warrior and run CCL/ Gamma Ray/ Bond log. Log shows
cement to 3000' w/ poor bond above 5250'. DC $ 9233 (CR)

6/23/06 Rig up B & C Quicktest and pressure test well to 9500 psi. Held pressure
for 15 min, tested good. (CR)

Completion- 1" Mobe- Spring Canyon

6/28/06 Rig up Black Warrior and RIH w/ 3 ¼ guns and perf Spring Canyon @
12,545-52' w/ 3 SPF @120°Spacing . RDMO wireline. (CR) DC $
l1,374 CCC $ 20,607

6/29/06 MIRU Superior Well Serv. (Paul and Kevin treating). Test lines to 9500
psi. Found 2810 psi SICP. Broke dn perfs @6200 psi @5 bpm. ISIP
5650. FG .89. Calc 12 holes open / 21. Gel fraced Spring Canyon Stg 1
w/ 91300# 20-40 Versaprop and 48000# 20-40 Magnaprop, using 2406
bbls 25 and 20# Borate XL gel. Screened out with 142 bbls flush away
(45 bbls short) to 8500 psi. ISIP N/A. Left 6800# sd in csg. Opened well
to flowback @12:15 PM w/ 7000 psi SICP on 10/64" ck. Well flg
7:00AM @2450 FCP on 14/64" ck. TR 603 in 18 ¾ hrs. BLWTR 1803.
Making 5-6 bph. Will go dn line as soon as sand trap installed, this AM.
(SCE) (SCE) DC $148,587 CCC $169,194

6/30/06 Put well dn line @10:00AM 6/29/06. Making 930 MCFD rate w/ 3300
FCP, on 12/64" ck. TR 619. BLWTR 1787. Final Report. (SCE)

Completion- 2ndMobe- Desert/Grassy, MvL

7/11/06 MIRU Superior and Black Warrior Wireline. RIH w/ Magnum 10K CBP
and guns to perf Stg 2 - Desert / Grassy. While running in hole, tools
stacked out @3260' +- (in sand bridge). Stuck. Opened well up on 12
and 14/64" ck. Tools came free and moved up hole to 3204' and stuck
again. Continued to flow well. No success getting tools free. Pumped
2% Kcl dn csg, staging in hole very slowly, w/ 47 bbls. No success.
Flowed 47 bb1sback, slowly at first, then harder. No success. Pumped dn
hole w/ 55 bbls (7 bbls more than csg cap @plug) w/ no success. Flowed
55 bb1sback. Tried to fire plug and set. Shorted. Had to pull out of rope
socket, leaving entire gun assy in hole @3204' (plug depth), w/ no cable
above rope socket . OAL of fish = 29.5'. Rope socket OD = 1 7/16" x
10 5/8" (w/ 1" tip). CCL OD 3.125" x 20 5/8". Guns OD = 3 3/8"
(scalloped and live)x 14'. Baker 10 setting tool and sleeve max OD =

RECEIVED

AU60 3 2006
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



3.125. RD Superior and BWWC and move to DSS 21-36-9-18. (SCE)
DC $41,033 (perf, frac) CCC $210,227

7/19/06 MORU service unit, lay pump lines and pump 80 bbls to control well.
NDFT and NU BOP, rig up tbg equip and pick up 3 ¾ overshot w/ 1 7/16
grapple, bumper sub, jars and 1 6' sub. RIH w/ tbg tallying off trailer. Fish
was not @3200', run past to 3400' and no tag. RIH w/ tbg to 3638' and
run into fish. Work fish for 15 min and start out of hole. POOH w/ 116 jts
and BHA. Lay down fish, plug was gone, break out tools and pick up 3 ¾
mill. RIH w/ 1jt, string float, l 17 jts tbg. Rig up swivel and break cire,
drill out plug. Lost circ for 30 sec and well started cire again. POOH w/ 2
jts and close well in for night and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $
14,265 CCC $ 224,492

7-20-06 Open well this AM and RIH w/ 1 jt, tag plug remainder and finish drilling
out. RIH w/ 279 jts tbg and tag up @12,582 w/ 397 jts total. POOH w/ 11
jts and shut down due to weather. Turn well down sales line. (Rick w/
Premier/ CR) DC $ 6148 CCC $ 230,640

7-21-06 Well flowing this AM @1200 psi. Continue POOH w/ 293 jts laying
down. Pump 50 bbls down tbg to control well and POOH w/ 92jts, X-
Nipple, 1 jt, 3 ¾ mill. ND BOP and NUFT, test well head and RDMO
location. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 6708 CCC $ 237,348

7/25/06 Rig up Superior @BWWC and RIH w/ plug and guns. Set 10k CBP @
12,058' and pressure test to 8000 psi. Bleed down to 3500 psi and shoot
stage #2 Desert / Grassy @12,040-43', 11,965-68', 11,936-38', 11,897-
99', w/ 2 3/8 scallop guns @3 spf @120 deg spacing. Break down perfs
@6407 @4.5 BPM, ISIP 4704, Calc shots open 29/30, FG .84. Gel frac
well w/ 1450 bbls 15#XL gel and 66,000# 20/40 versa prop sand. Screen
well out 100 bbls into 3# stage. Turn well over to flow back @4:00 pm on
a 16/64 ck, @8400 psi (CR)

7/26/06 Well flowing this AM @1350 psi on a 16/64 ck. Flowed 938 bbls in 14
hrs, TA 938, BLWTR 612. Rig up BWWC and RIH w/ plug and guns. Set
8 k FTFP @l1,306' and pressure test to 8000 psi, bleed off to 3500 psi.
Shoot stage # 3 Lower Mesaverde @10,998-11,001', 11,023-26',
11,095-98', 12,288-91'. Break down perfs @5380 psi @4 BPM, ISIP
4750, Calc shots open @18/36, FG .87. Hybrid frac well w/ 3199 bb1s
20#1iner and Borate XL fluid and 118,000# 20/40 Ottawa sand,15,000#
20/40 Versa prop, 48,000# Temp DC sand. Flush well w/ 162.1 bbls. ISIP
4950, FG .89. Turn well over to flowback @l1:30 AM @4900 psi on a
10/64 ck. Well cleaned up @RIH w/ plug and guns for stage #4. Set 8 K
FTFP @10,948' and pressure test to 8000 psi. Bleed off to 5500 psi and
shoot stage 4 Lower Mesaverde @ 10,677-80', 10,774-76', 10,836-39',
10,922-25'. Perfs broke down during perforating, continue pumping

3.125. RD Superior and BWWC and move to DSS 21-36-9-18. (SCE)
DC $41,033 (perf, frac) CCC $210,227

7/19/06 MORU service unit, lay pump lines and pump 80 bbls to control well.
NDFT and NU BOP, rig up tbg equip and pick up 3 ¾ overshot w/ 1 7/16
grapple, bumper sub, jars and 1 6' sub. RIH w/ tbg tallying off trailer. Fish
was not @3200', run past to 3400' and no tag. RIH w/ tbg to 3638' and
run into fish. Work fish for 15 min and start out of hole. POOH w/ 116 jts
and BHA. Lay down fish, plug was gone, break out tools and pick up 3 ¾
mill. RIH w/ 1jt, string float, l 17 jts tbg. Rig up swivel and break cire,
drill out plug. Lost circ for 30 sec and well started cire again. POOH w/ 2
jts and close well in for night and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $
14,265 CCC $ 224,492

7-20-06 Open well this AM and RIH w/ 1 jt, tag plug remainder and finish drilling
out. RIH w/ 279 jts tbg and tag up @12,582 w/ 397 jts total. POOH w/ 11
jts and shut down due to weather. Turn well down sales line. (Rick w/
Premier/ CR) DC $ 6148 CCC $ 230,640

7-21-06 Well flowing this AM @1200 psi. Continue POOH w/ 293 jts laying
down. Pump 50 bbls down tbg to control well and POOH w/ 92jts, X-
Nipple, 1 jt, 3 ¾ mill. ND BOP and NUFT, test well head and RDMO
location. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 6708 CCC $ 237,348

7/25/06 Rig up Superior @BWWC and RIH w/ plug and guns. Set 10k CBP @
12,058' and pressure test to 8000 psi. Bleed down to 3500 psi and shoot
stage #2 Desert / Grassy @12,040-43', 11,965-68', 11,936-38', 11,897-
99', w/ 2 3/8 scallop guns @3 spf @120 deg spacing. Break down perfs
@6407 @4.5 BPM, ISIP 4704, Calc shots open 29/30, FG .84. Gel frac
well w/ 1450 bbls 15#XL gel and 66,000# 20/40 versa prop sand. Screen
well out 100 bbls into 3# stage. Turn well over to flow back @4:00 pm on
a 16/64 ck, @8400 psi (CR)

7/26/06 Well flowing this AM @1350 psi on a 16/64 ck. Flowed 938 bbls in 14
hrs, TA 938, BLWTR 612. Rig up BWWC and RIH w/ plug and guns. Set
8 k FTFP @l1,306' and pressure test to 8000 psi, bleed off to 3500 psi.
Shoot stage # 3 Lower Mesaverde @10,998-11,001', 11,023-26',
11,095-98', 12,288-91'. Break down perfs @5380 psi @4 BPM, ISIP
4750, Calc shots open @18/36, FG .87. Hybrid frac well w/ 3199 bb1s
20#1iner and Borate XL fluid and 118,000# 20/40 Ottawa sand,15,000#
20/40 Versa prop, 48,000# Temp DC sand. Flush well w/ 162.1 bbls. ISIP
4950, FG .89. Turn well over to flowback @l1:30 AM @4900 psi on a
10/64 ck. Well cleaned up @RIH w/ plug and guns for stage #4. Set 8 K
FTFP @10,948' and pressure test to 8000 psi. Bleed off to 5500 psi and
shoot stage 4 Lower Mesaverde @ 10,677-80', 10,774-76', 10,836-39',
10,922-25'. Perfs broke down during perforating, continue pumping



BPM @4800 psi while POOH w/ wireline. Break down perfs @4800 psi
@2 BPM, ISIP 4320, FG .84, calc shots open 17/33 shots. Hybrid frac
well w/ 2897 bbls of 20# linear and Borate XL gel and 124,000 # 20/40
white sand, 5000# 20/40 Versa prop, 49,000# Temp DC sand. Flush well
w/ 157.3 bbls, ISIP 4350, FG .85. Turn well over to flowback @8:00 PM
@4500 psi on a 10/64 ck. (CR) DC $ 277,363

7/27/06 Well flowing this AM @4000 psi on a 14/64 ck, flowed 1477 bb1sin 15
½ hrs. TA 2415, BLWTR 5396. (CR)

7/28/06 Well flowing this AM @3100 psi on a 16/64 ck, flowed 1789 bbls in 24
hrs. TA 4204, BLWTR 3607. Turned well down sales @3:00 pm. (CR)

8/2/06 Road rig to location spot in and rig up. Spot pump and tank, tbg trailers
and lay pump lines. Rig up BWWC and try to run kill plug, unable to run
plug due to mechanical problems w/ wireline truck. Turn well down sales
and shut down for day. (CR) DC $ 5013 CCC $ 282,376

8/3/06 Well plugged up during night. Well flowing @3700 psi on a 12/64 ck.
Watch well and try to bleed down. Shut down for day to let well flow back
down sales. (CR) DC $4500 CCC $

BPM @4800 psi while POOH w/ wireline. Break down perfs @4800 psi
@2 BPM, ISIP 4320, FG .84, calc shots open 17/33 shots. Hybrid frac
well w/ 2897 bbls of 20# linear and Borate XL gel and 124,000 # 20/40
white sand, 5000# 20/40 Versa prop, 49,000# Temp DC sand. Flush well
w/ 157.3 bbls, ISIP 4350, FG .85. Turn well over to flowback @8:00 PM
@4500 psi on a 10/64 ck. (CR) DC $ 277,363

7/27/06 Well flowing this AM @4000 psi on a 14/64 ck, flowed 1477 bb1sin 15
½ hrs. TA 2415, BLWTR 5396. (CR)

7/28/06 Well flowing this AM @3100 psi on a 16/64 ck, flowed 1789 bbls in 24
hrs. TA 4204, BLWTR 3607. Turned well down sales @3:00 pm. (CR)

8/2/06 Road rig to location spot in and rig up. Spot pump and tank, tbg trailers
and lay pump lines. Rig up BWWC and try to run kill plug, unable to run
plug due to mechanical problems w/ wireline truck. Turn well down sales
and shut down for day. (CR) DC $ 5013 CCC $ 282,376

8/3/06 Well plugged up during night. Well flowing @3700 psi on a 12/64 ck.
Watch well and try to bleed down. Shut down for day to let well flow back
down sales. (CR) DC $4500 CCC $



Form 31<e s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5 Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to drlH or to mnter an 6 If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned weH. Use Form 31&3 (APD) for such proposais. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If unitor cA. Agreement Name and/or No.

L
O

WWH
Gas weil other 8 Well Name and No.

NA

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9- I8
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No (include area code> 043-047-36740
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 801 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage. Sec . T. R., M .
or Survey Description) Riverbend

I I County or Parish, State
2052' FSL & 1932' FWL NE SW of Section 25-T9S-RI8E

Uintah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shutoff

Altering Casing Fracture Treal Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (cleady state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deependirotionallyor recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond unds which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on life with BLM/BIA Required subsg¡uent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved opemtions lf the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316M shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only afla all requirements, including reclamation, have bem completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This well was started on proth¿clion on June 30, 2006.

RECENED
JULO5 2006

DN.0FOIL,GAS&MIN\NG
14. I hereby certify that the foregoingis true and correct.

Name (Printed 7pped)

Beverly Walje¢Ÿ Engineering Technician

signatu Date
June 30, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page

Form 31<e s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5 Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to drlH or to mnter an 6 If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned weH. Use Form 31&3 (APD) for such proposais. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If unitor cA. Agreement Name and/or No.

L
O

WWH
Gas weil other 8 Well Name and No.

NA

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9- I8
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No (include area code> 043-047-36740
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 801 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage. Sec . T. R., M .
or Survey Description) Riverbend

I I County or Parish, State
2052' FSL & 1932' FWL NE SW of Section 25-T9S-RI8E

Uintah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shutoff

Altering Casing Fracture Treal Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (cleady state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deependirotionallyor recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond unds which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on life with BLM/BIA Required subsg¡uent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved opemtions lf the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316M shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only afla all requirements, including reclamation, have bem completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This well was started on proth¿clion on June 30, 2006.

RECENED
JULO5 2006

DN.0FOIL,GAS&MIN\NG

14. I hereby certify that the foregoingis true and correct.
Name (Printed 7pped)

Beverly Walje¢Ÿ Engineering Technician

signatu Date
June 30, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page



Form 3160. s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Selial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803
DO not use ffils forta f0Tptoposals to drill Or to itMpnteran 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Fonn 31 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instmetions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. AgreementName and/or No.

I. Type of Well

Oil well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator See list below
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4. Location of Well (Footage, he . E, R , M ,
or Survey Description)

I 1. County or Parish, State

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

if the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete hosizontally, give subsurface locationsand measured and tme vertical depthsofall pertinot markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or providethe Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filedwithin 30 days
following completion of the involved opemtions. If theopemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Forn 316(M shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have bem completed, and the opetator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that effective immediately we will be disposing of produced
water fromwells within this lease as follows:

All produced water fi·omthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
State Evaporation Facility NW1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E Uintah County, Utah. Which is owne by
Gasco Production Company.A copy ofthe approved permit for this facilityis attachedACCOP

Og Gas a

The wells within this lease are: g g(QÛ
Federal 7-25A SW NE of Sec 25-T9S-R18E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-30624

Sheep Wash Fed 23-25-9-18 NE SW of Sec 25-T9S-R18E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-36740

Sheep Wash Fed 41-25-9-18 NE NE of Sec 25-T9S-R18E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-36772

Sheep Wash Fed 43-25-9-18 NE SE of Sec 25-T9S-R18E Uintah Cnty, Utah o43-047-366oo RECE IVED
OCT242006

S&MINING
Name (Printed 7pped)

Title

Date

/ THISSP1CE FOR FEDERALOR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable tide to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entide the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructi<msempage

Form 3160. s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Selial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803
DO not use ffils forta f0Tptoposals to drill Or to itMpnteran 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Fonn 31 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instmetions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. AgreementName and/or No.

I. Type of Well

Oil well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator See list below
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4. Location of Well (Footage, he . E, R , M ,
or Survey Description)

I 1. County or Parish, State

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

if the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete hosizontally, give subsurface locationsand measured and tme vertical depthsofall pertinot markers and zones.

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or providethe Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filedwithin 30 days
following completion of the involved opemtions. If theopemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Forn 316(M shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have bem completed, and the opetator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that effective immediately we will be disposing of produced
water fromwells within this lease as follows:

All produced water fi·omthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
State Evaporation Facility NW1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E Uintah County, Utah. Which is owne by
Gasco Production Company.A copy ofthe approved permit for this facilityis attachedACCOP

Og Gas a

The wells within this lease are: g g(QÛ
Federal 7-25A SW NE of Sec 25-T9S-R18E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-30624

Sheep Wash Fed 23-25-9-18 NE SW of Sec 25-T9S-R18E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-36740

Sheep Wash Fed 41-25-9-18 NE NE of Sec 25-T9S-R18E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-36772

Sheep Wash Fed 43-25-9-18 NE SE of Sec 25-T9S-R18E Uintah Cnty, Utah o43-047-366oo RECE IVED
OCT242006

S&MINING
Name (Printed 7pped)

Title

Date

/ THISSP1CE FOR FEDERALOR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable tide to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entide the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructi<msempage



Form3160-s UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to IB-enteran 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 31&3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well

Oil well Gas Weil Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9- I8
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 043-047-36740
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T. R, M, or Survey Description) Riverbend
I l. County or Parish, State

2052' FSL & 1932' FWL NE SW of Section 25-T9S-Rl8E
Uintah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTlON

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Produclion ( Start/ Resume) Water Shut-ofT

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Inlegnty

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporanly Abandon EFM Meter

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deependirœlionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all peltinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond unds which the work will be pelformed or provide the Bond No. on lile with BLM/BlA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3\604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only afta all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site is ready for linal inspection.

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 35oo) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

RECEIVED
JULO52006

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is trie and correct
glyopQ\LGAS&MINING

Name (Printed 7pped)
Title

Beverly Walkpr? Engineering Technician

signatur Date
June 30, 2006

THIS SPACE OR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Acceptea

Approved by Title Date ¡q
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or d M\nné
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office \\ GSS ActionIsNecessary
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon i

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any perso i I y departmentor agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter withi ctigg

(Instructions on page

Form3160-s UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to IB-enteran 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 31&3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well

Oil well Gas Weil Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9- I8
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 043-047-36740
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T. R, M, or Survey Description) Riverbend
I l. County or Parish, State

2052' FSL & 1932' FWL NE SW of Section 25-T9S-Rl8E
Uintah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTlON

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Produclion ( Start/ Resume) Water Shut-ofT

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Inlegnty

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporanly Abandon EFM Meter

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deependirœlionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all peltinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond unds which the work will be pelformed or provide the Bond No. on lile with BLM/BlA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3\604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only afta all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the opemtor has
determined that the site is ready for linal inspection.

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 35oo) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

RECEIVED
JULO52006

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is trie and correct
glyopQ\LGAS&MINING

Name (Printed 7pped)
Title

Beverly Walkpr? Engineering Technician

signatur Date
June 30, 2006

THIS SPACE OR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Acceptea

Approved by Title Date ¡q
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or d M\nné
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office \\ GSS ActionIsNecessary
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon i

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any perso i I y departmentor agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter withi ctigg

(Instructions on page



Form 3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. Lease Serial No.

UTU-9803

l a. Type of Well Oil Well Gas O Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: O New Q Work Over O Deepen Plug Back DifT Resvr. NA
Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

NA
2. Name of Operator

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Liasco Production t'omp my Sheep Wash Federa I 23-25-9- I8
3. Address 3a Phone No. (include area code)

9. API Well No.
8 Interness Drive East Suite 100. Englewood. Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 43-047-36740
4. I,ocation of Well (Report locations clear/v and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surloce 205T FSI & 1932' EWl. Riverbend

I I. Sec.. T., R., M., or Block and
At top prod. interval reported below Same Survey or Area Sec 25-T95-R 181

12. County or Parish 13. State

At total depth same Hintah | Iitah
14 Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. le Complete 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

D & A Ready to Prod.
02/22/06 06/05 06 4877 (il : 4895' KB()6/30/06

18 Total Depth: MD 12756 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 1262() 20. Depth I-ridge Plug Set: MD NA
TVD 12756 TVD 12620 TVD NA

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22 Was well No O Yes (Submit copy)
Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)

UNI : CBL; SL Directional Ô No O Yes (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)
. Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry VolHole Size Size/Grade W1. (#lft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount PulledDepth Type of Cement (BBL)

17 I 2" 13 3/8 114( 48# 0 220' 300 ss ol classfi Cire to suri
12 I/4" 8 5/8 J-55 32# 0 3,519' 700 sx of Class O Circ to Surf

7 7/8" 4 I 2 P110 13 5# 0 12,713' 375 si of Ifilin 3000' CRI.
In l0 sy of 50-50

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)
2 -3/8" !2.050'

25 Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf Status
Blackhank I 1897 12552 See Attached
Mesaverde 10677 I 1291

D)
E)
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
See Attached

HH:HVH)
FEB2 62007

28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method Ulv.OFOlL,GAS&MINING
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr API Gravity

06/30/06 07/01/06 24 9 0 1,554 70 Flowing
Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size Flwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr API

I4/64" SI 0 I55I N 0 1,554 70 Producing from A
28a.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr API Gravity

07/28/06 08 07 06 24 4 7 1854 155 Flowing
Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravny Well Status
Size FIwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr API

14/64" SI 0 2843 4 7 1854 155 Produciny from A & B
(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse

Form 3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. Lease Serial No.

UTU-9803

l a. Type of Well Oil Well Gas O Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: O New Q Work Over O Deepen Plug Back DifT Resvr. NA
Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

NA
2. Name of Operator

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Liasco Production t'omp my Sheep Wash Federa I 23-25-9- I8
3. Address 3a Phone No. (include area code)

9. API Well No.
8 Interness Drive East Suite 100. Englewood. Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 43-047-36740
4. I,ocation of Well (Report locations clear/v and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surloce 205T FSI & 1932' EWl. Riverbend

I I. Sec.. T., R., M., or Block and
At top prod. interval reported below Same Survey or Area Sec 25-T95-R 181

12. County or Parish 13. State

At total depth same Hintah | Iitah
14 Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. le Complete 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

D & A Ready to Prod.
02/22/06 06/05 06 4877 (il : 4895' KB()6/30/06

18 Total Depth: MD 12756 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 1262() 20. Depth I-ridge Plug Set: MD NA
TVD 12756 TVD 12620 TVD NA

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22 Was well No O Yes (Submit copy)
Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)

UNI : CBL; SL Directional Ô No O Yes (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)
. Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry VolHole Size Size/Grade W1. (#lft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount PulledDepth Type of Cement (BBL)

17 I 2" 13 3/8 114( 48# 0 220' 300 ss ol classfi Cire to suri
12 I/4" 8 5/8 J-55 32# 0 3,519' 700 sx of Class O Circ to Surf

7 7/8" 4 I 2 P110 13 5# 0 12,713' 375 si of Ifilin 3000' CRI.
In l0 sy of 50-50

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)
2 -3/8" !2.050'

25 Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf Status
Blackhank I 1897 12552 See Attached
Mesaverde 10677 I 1291

D)
E)
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
See Attached

HH:HVH)
FEB2 62007

28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method Ulv.OFOlL,GAS&MINING
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr API Gravity

06/30/06 07/01/06 24 9 0 1,554 70 Flowing
Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size Flwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr API

I4/64" SI 0 I55I N 0 1,554 70 Producing from A
28a.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr API Gravity

07/28/06 08 07 06 24 4 7 1854 155 Flowing
Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravny Well Status
Size FIwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr API

14/64" SI 0 2843 4 7 1854 155 Produciny from A & B
(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse



28b.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production - Interval E
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Product on BBL MCF BBL Corr API

Choke Tag Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Waler Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBI MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Sold. used forfite/ vented etc )
Sold

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descripiions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas Depth

Wasatch 5,288 9,105
Dark Canyon 9,105 9,371
Mesaverde 9,37\ \ I.6l7
Blackhawk i 1,863 Well was td'd within the Blackhawk (ä)12,756'

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procet ure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:

1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (I full set reg'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5 Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name /pfense print) Beverly Walker Title Engineering Tech

Signature Date

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S C. Section 1212, make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

o U.S. GPO:

28b.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production - Interval E
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Product on BBL MCF BBL Corr API

Choke Tag Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Waler Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBI MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Sold. used forfite/ vented etc )
Sold

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descripiions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas Depth

Wasatch 5,288 9,105
Dark Canyon 9,105 9,371
Mesaverde 9,37\ \ I.6l7
Blackhawk i 1,863 Well was td'd within the Blackhawk (ä)12,756'

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procet ure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:

1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (I full set reg'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5 Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name /pfense print) Beverly Walker Title Engineering Tech

Signature Date

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S C. Section 1212, make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

o U.S. GPO:



Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

27. Perforation Record
Perforated Interval Size do. Hole Perf Status

12545-52, 12040-43; 11965-68; 11936-38; 11897-99 0.38 51 Open

I1288-91; I1095-98; I1023-26; 10998-11001, 10922-25; 10836-39; 10774-76; 10677-80 0.38 69 Open

28. Acid Fracture, Treatmen , Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued)
Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
12545 - 12552' 91300# 20-40 Versaprop and 48000# 20-40 Magnaprop, using 2406 bbis 25 and 20# Borate XL gel
I 1897 - 12043" 1450 bbis 15#XL gel and 66,000# 20/40 versa prop sand

Hybrid frac well w/ 3199 bbis 20# liner and Borate XL fluid and I18,000# 20/40 Ottawa sand,15,000# 20/40
10998 - 11291' Versa prop,48,000# Temp DC sand

2897 bbis of20# linear and Borate XL gel and 124,000 # 20/40 white sand, 5000# 20/40 Versa prop, 49,000#
10677 - 10925' Temp DC sand

RECEIVED
FEB2 6 2007

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&

Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

27. Perforation Record
Perforated Interval Size do. Hole Perf Status

12545-52, 12040-43; 11965-68; 11936-38; 11897-99 0.38 51 Open

I1288-91; I1095-98; I1023-26; 10998-11001, 10922-25; 10836-39; 10774-76; 10677-80 0.38 69 Open

28. Acid Fracture, Treatmen , Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued)
Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
12545 - 12552' 91300# 20-40 Versaprop and 48000# 20-40 Magnaprop, using 2406 bbis 25 and 20# Borate XL gel
I 1897 - 12043" 1450 bbis 15#XL gel and 66,000# 20/40 versa prop sand

Hybrid frac well w/ 3199 bbis 20# liner and Borate XL fluid and I18,000# 20/40 Ottawa sand,15,000# 20/40
10998 - 11291' Versa prop,48,000# Temp DC sand

2897 bbis of20# linear and Borate XL gel and 124,000 # 20/40 white sand, 5000# 20/40 Versa prop, 49,000#
10677 - 10925' Temp DC sand

RECEIVED
FEB2 6 2007

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&



Fofm3160-5= UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresJnovember30,2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-oog803

Do not use firisform for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals- NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Otirer instructions on reverse side
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

I. Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-1ß
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a Address 3b Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36740
81nverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado Borr2 303-483-¤¤44 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
i I.ocation of Well (Toorage. See

. T. R.. M. or Surver Description) Riverbend
2O52'FSL & 1932'FWL I l. County or Parish, State

NE SW of Section 25-T9S-R18E
Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURii OF NOTICE. REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-OIT
Alter Casing Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Q Recomplete Other diff NPCilflig
Change Plans Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection O Plug Back Q Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approxiate duration thereof
if the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BI M/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowing completion of the involved operations if the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed oncetesting has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdetermined that the site isready for final inspection

Please find attached the site security diagram for this well.

It I herebycertify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Beverhi Walker Engineering Technician
Signatu Date

MGPCII 8, 2007
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

onditions of approval, ifany, are attached Approval of this notice does noi warrant or Ollice
:erti that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those nghts to the sab¡ect lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operat ions thereon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States any
false. fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Instruenons on reverse)

RECE1VED
MAR1 2 2007

DN.0F0\L,GAS&

Fofm3160-5= UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresJnovember30,2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-oog803

Do not use firisform for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals- NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Otirer instructions on reverse side
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

I. Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-1ß
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a Address 3b Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36740
81nverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado Borr2 303-483-¤¤44 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
i I.ocation of Well (Toorage. See

. T. R.. M. or Surver Description) Riverbend
2O52'FSL & 1932'FWL I l. County or Parish, State

NE SW of Section 25-T9S-R18E
Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURii OF NOTICE. REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-OIT
Alter Casing Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Q Recomplete Other diff NPCilflig
Change Plans Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection O Plug Back Q Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approxiate duration thereof
if the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BI M/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowing completion of the involved operations if the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed oncetesting has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator hasdetermined that the site isready for final inspection

Please find attached the site security diagram for this well.

It I herebycertify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Beverhi Walker Engineering Technician
Signatu Date

MGPCII 8, 2007
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

onditions of approval, ifany, are attached Approval of this notice does noi warrant or Ollice
:erti that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those nghts to the sab¡ect lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operat ions thereon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States any
false. fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Instruenons on reverse)

RECE1VED
MAR1 2 2007

DN.0F0\L,GAS&



- meter
Pit (to be closed)

-isl Producedco
Water

300 bbl

Site Berm 325 gal
Drip Tank

Condensate
Dngatch 300 bbi

(i

500
Gal

Meth

55x35 x3'

Flow Direction vWell
Head sales

This lease is subject to the
Site Security Plan Ior GASCO LEGEND

Production Cornpany The S Sales Valve
Plan is located at D Drain Valve

GASCO Production Cornpany I Infel Valve
8 Inverness Dnve Easi O -Overtion

Suite 100 B Blowdown
Englewood. CO 80112 5625 V Vent

POSITION OF VALVESAND USE OF SEALS DURING PRODUCTION/BLOWOOWN
Valves Line Purpose Position Seal Installed

D Drain Closed Yes
S Sales Closed Yes
I Inlel Open NO

O Overflow Open/Closed No
B Blowdown Open/Closed No

POSITION OF VALVESAND USE OF SEALS DURING SALES
Valves Line PurpÃe F osition Sed Installed

D Drain Closed Yes
s sales även No

Inler Closed Ye= BUYS Sc ASSOCIATES, INC.O Overflow Cosed Yes
B Blowdown Oosed Yes ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULTANTS

POSITIONOF VALVESAND USE OF SEALS DUR NG WATER DRAIN
Valves Line Purpose siÑon Seal Installed

o ord oies N GASCO Production CompanyS Sales Closed Yes
ice ao e no Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18

e NNo

NE/SW Sec. 25, Twp. 9S, Rge. 18E
Uintah County,

- meter
Pit (to be closed)

-isl Producedco
Water

300 bbl

Site Berm 325 gal
Drip Tank

Condensate
Dngatch 300 bbi

(i

500
Gal

Meth

55x35 x3'

Flow Direction vWell
Head sales

This lease is subject to the
Site Security Plan Ior GASCO LEGEND

Production Cornpany The S Sales Valve
Plan is located at D Drain Valve

GASCO Production Cornpany I Infel Valve
8 Inverness Dnve Easi O -Overtion

Suite 100 B Blowdown
Englewood. CO 80112 5625 V Vent

POSITION OF VALVESAND USE OF SEALS DURING PRODUCTION/BLOWOOWN
Valves Line Purpose Position Seal Installed

D Drain Closed Yes
S Sales Closed Yes
I Inlel Open NO

O Overflow Open/Closed No
B Blowdown Open/Closed No

POSITION OF VALVESAND USE OF SEALS DURING SALES
Valves Line PurpÃe F osition Sed Installed

D Drain Closed Yes
s sales även No

Inler Closed Ye= BUYS Sc ASSOCIATES, INC.O Overflow Cosed Yes
B Blowdown Oosed Yes ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULTANTS

POSITIONOF VALVESAND USE OF SEALS DUR NG WATER DRAIN
Valves Line Purpose siÑon Seal Installed

o ord oies N GASCO Production CompanyS Sales Closed Yes
ice ao e no Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18

e NNo

NE/SW Sec. 25, Twp. 9S, Rge. 18E
Uintah County,



API Well No: 43047367400000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-9803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2052 FSL 1932 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

5/15/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco intends to complete all remaining productive zones in the Mesaverde
and Wasatch formations. Each zone will be stimulated with roughly 2,000 bbls

of slickwater and 60,000#'s of sand. Gasco also intends to commingle all
production from the Wasatch and Mesaverde zones. Gasco is the owner of the
minerals in all contiguous 40 acre offsets. A map is included showing this. If
for some reason Gasco is not the owner, production will be allocated using

hydrocarbon pore volume calculations. Gasco requests the State accept this
in lieu of the required affidavit. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Matt Owens

TITLE
 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5/5/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 483-0044  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 996-1839

May 05, 2010

May 11, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047367400000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEASOE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

2052 FSL 1932 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to complete all remaining productive zones in the Mesaverde
and Wasatch formations. Each zone will be stimulated with roughly 2,000 bbls Accepted by the

of slickwater and 60,000#'s of sand. Gasco also intends to commingle all Utah Division of
production from the Wasatch and Mesaverde zones. Gasco is the owner of the Oil, Gas and Mining

minerals in all contiguous 40 acre offsets. A map is included showing this. If
for some reason Gasco is not the owner, production will be allocated usinþate: Ma 11, 2;010

,

hydrocarbon pore volume calculations. Gasco requests the State accept this
in lieu of the required affidavit. By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/5/2010

RECEIVED May 05,

iPI Well No: 43047367400000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 5.LEASOE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

2052 FSL 1932 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

5/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to complete all remaining productive zones in the Mesaverde
and Wasatch formations. Each zone will be stimulated with roughly 2,000 bbls Accepted by the

of slickwater and 60,000#'s of sand. Gasco also intends to commingle all Utah Division of
production from the Wasatch and Mesaverde zones. Gasco is the owner of the Oil, Gas and Mining

minerals in all contiguous 40 acre offsets. A map is included showing this. If
for some reason Gasco is not the owner, production will be allocated usinþate: Ma 11, 2;010

,

hydrocarbon pore volume calculations. Gasco requests the State accept this
in lieu of the required affidavit. By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/5/2010

RECEIVED May 05,



May 05, 2010

SHEEP WÄSH FEDERASHEEP WASH FEDERAL

MAPCO PR DUCTION CO
FEDERAL 5-25A

32-25-9-18

12-25-9-18

SHEEP WASH FEDERAL

23-25-9-18

SHEEP WASH FEDERAL
SHEEP WASH FEDERALP,

14-25-9-18 34-25-9-18

DESERT SPRING STATE
Gasco LeaseS 660 0 660 A

Gasco Sheep Wash Federal
23-25-9-18

Sec 25 T9S-R18E, Uintah County, Utah

RECEIVED May 05,

SHEEP WÄSH FEDERASHEEP WASH FEDERAL

MAPCO PR DUCTION CO
FEDERAL 5-25A

32-25-9-18

12-25-9-18

SHEEP WASH FEDERAL

23-25-9-18

SHEEP WASH FEDERAL
SHEEP WASH FEDERALP,

14-25-9-18 34-25-9-18

DESERT SPRING STATE

Gasco LeaseS 660 0 660 A

Gasco Sheep Wash Federal
23-25-9-18

Sec 25 T9S-R18E, Uintah County, Utah

RECEIVED May 05,



API Well No: 43047367400000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-9803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2052 FSL 1932 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

6/2/2010

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco finished fracture treating the last two productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation and one productive interval in the Wasatch formation
and landed tubing on 6/2/2010. The amount of sand and water pumped in
each stage can be found on the attached document under Stage 5, 6, & 7.

The well is currently producing from the Mesaverde and Wasatch formations.
This well was put back on production immediately following work completion.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Matt Owens

TITLE
 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 6/16/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 483-0044  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 996-1839

June 16, 2010

June 22, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047367400000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

2052 FSL 1932 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

WENrkRCEPmOpRetion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

6/2/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco finished fracture treating the last two productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation and one productive interval in the Wasatch formationAccepted by the
and landed tubing on 6/2/2010. The amount of sand and water pumped in Utah Division of
each stage can be found on the attached document under Stage 5, 6, & ¯Oil, Gas and Mining

The well is currently producing from the Mesaverde and Wasatch formFOR RE D ONLY
This well was put back on production immediately following work completTon. Y, 20TU

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/16/2010

RECEIVED June 16,

iPI Well No: 43047367400000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOEDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6.IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

2052 FSL 1932 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

WENrkRCEPmOpRetion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

6/2/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco finished fracture treating the last two productive intervals in the
Mesaverde formation and one productive interval in the Wasatch formationAccepted by the
and landed tubing on 6/2/2010. The amount of sand and water pumped in Utah Division of
each stage can be found on the attached document under Stage 5, 6, & ¯Oil, Gas and Mining

The well is currently producing from the Mesaverde and Wasatch formFOR RE D ONLY
This well was put back on production immediately following work completTon. Y, 20TU

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 6/16/2010

RECEIVED June 16,



June 16, 2010

LEASE:inac WELL #: Sheep Wash Federal23-25-9-18
FIELD: Riverbend

LOCATION:
COUNTY: Uintah ST: Utah API: 43-047-36740

GL: 4877'
SPUD DATE: 2/22/2006
COMP DATE: 6/30/2006

CONDUCTOR

SIZE: 13 3/8"
WT/GRD: H-40 DATE FIRST PRODUCED 6/30/06
WT/GRD: 48# I I PRODUCTION METHOD Flow
CSA: 220' CHOKE SIZE 14/64
SX: 300 sx Class G Csg PRESSURE 1551
CIRC: Y OIL (BBL) O
TOC: Surf GAS (MCF) 1554
HOLE SIZE: 17 1/2" WATER (BBL) 70

SURFACE CASING
SIZE: 8 5/8"
WT/GRD: J-55
WT/GRD: 32#
CSA: 3,519
SX: 700 sx Class G

CIRC: Y
TOC: Surf 295 jts of 2 3/8" Tubing to 9,413' (6/2/2010}
HOLE SIZE: 12 1/4"

PRODUCTION CASING
SIZE: 4 1/2"
WT/GRD: P I 10
WT/GRD: 13.5#
CSA: 12,713
SX: 375 sx Hi-Lift

1610 sx 50/50 Poz
CIRC: Y
TOC: 3000'
HOLE SIZE: 7 7/8"

Stimulation

Stage 7: ,155# 100 mesh sand, 43,902#30/50 white = = 8942-44 8960-62 Stage 7 - Wasatch
(5/14/2010) and, 4,968# 30/50 curable resin coated sand, = = 9022-26 9079-83 Stage 7 - Wasatch

6 bbisFR slick water
= 9140-44 Stage 6 - Dark Canyon

Stage 6: ,869# 100 mesh sand, 69,338# 30/50 white a = 9182-84 9250-54 Stage 6 - Dark Canyon
(5/14/2010) and, 7,400# 30/50 curable resin coated sand. = = 9346-48 9362-64 Stage 6 - Dark Canyon

,545 bbis FR slick water Eo 9 tir
= 9960-62 Stage 5 - Upper Mesaverde

, = 10066-72 10094-98 Stage 5 - Upper Mesaverde
Stage 5: ,701# 100 mesh sand, 62,628# 30/50
(5/14/2010) hite sand, 6,600# 30/50 curable resin = = 10677-80 Stage 4 - Lower Mesaverde

oated sand, 1,62I bbls FR slick water = = 10774-76 Stage 4 - Lower Mesaverde
= 10836-39 Stage 4 - Lower Mesaverde
= 10922-25 Stage 4 - Lower Mesaverde

Stage 4: 897 bbis of 20# linear and Borate XL gel and
(7/26/06) 24,000 # 20/40 white sand,5000# 20/40 Versa

rop. 49,000# Temp DC sand = 10998-11101 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde
= 11023-26 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde
= 11095-98 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde

Stage 3: ybrid frac well w/ 3199 bbls20#1iner and = 11288-91 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde
(7/26/06) orate XL fluid and I 18,000# 20/40 Ottawa

and,15.000#20/40 Versa prop, 48,000# Temp
C sand = 11897-99 Stage 2 - Desert/Grassy

IIP

• = 11936-38 Stage 2 - Desert/Grassy
Stage 2: 1450 bbis IS#XL gel and 66,000# 20/40 versa

a = 11965-68 Stage 2 - Desert/Grassy
(7/25/06) rop sand

= 12040-43 Stage 2 - Desert/Grassy

* = 12545-52 Stage 1 - Spring Canyon
Stage 1: I300# 20-40 Versaprop and 48000# 20-40
(6/29/06) agnaprop, using 2406 bb1s 25 and 20# Borate 3-3/4" Bit x POBS (8/10/06) (5/27/2010)

L gel

PBTD @ 12552' (5/28/2010)
MD 12,756
TD 12,756

RECEIVED June 16,

LEASE:inac WELL #: Sheep Wash Federal23-25-9-18
FIELD: Riverbend

LOCATION:
COUNTY: Uintah ST: Utah API: 43-047-36740

GL: 4877'
SPUD DATE: 2/22/2006
COMP DATE: 6/30/2006

CONDUCTOR

SIZE: 13 3/8"
WT/GRD: H-40 DATE FIRST PRODUCED 6/30/06
WT/GRD: 48# I I PRODUCTION METHOD Flow
CSA: 220' CHOKE SIZE 14/64
SX: 300 sx Class G Csg PRESSURE 1551
CIRC: Y OIL (BBL) O
TOC: Surf GAS (MCF) 1554
HOLE SIZE: 17 1/2" WATER (BBL) 70

SURFACE CASING
SIZE: 8 5/8"
WT/GRD: J-55
WT/GRD: 32#
CSA: 3,519
SX: 700 sx Class G

CIRC: Y
TOC: Surf 295 jts of 2 3/8" Tubing to 9,413' (6/2/2010}
HOLE SIZE: 12 1/4"

PRODUCTION CASING
SIZE: 4 1/2"
WT/GRD: P I 10
WT/GRD: 13.5#
CSA: 12,713
SX: 375 sx Hi-Lift

1610 sx 50/50 Poz
CIRC: Y
TOC: 3000'
HOLE SIZE: 7 7/8"

Stimulation

Stage 7: ,155# 100 mesh sand, 43,902#30/50 white = = 8942-44 8960-62 Stage 7 - Wasatch
(5/14/2010) and, 4,968# 30/50 curable resin coated sand, = = 9022-26 9079-83 Stage 7 - Wasatch

6 bbisFR slick water
= 9140-44 Stage 6 - Dark Canyon

Stage 6: ,869# 100 mesh sand, 69,338# 30/50 white a = 9182-84 9250-54 Stage 6 - Dark Canyon
(5/14/2010) and, 7,400# 30/50 curable resin coated sand. = = 9346-48 9362-64 Stage 6 - Dark Canyon

,545 bbis FR slick water Eo 9 tir
= 9960-62 Stage 5 - Upper Mesaverde

, = 10066-72 10094-98 Stage 5 - Upper Mesaverde
Stage 5: ,701# 100 mesh sand, 62,628# 30/50
(5/14/2010) hite sand, 6,600# 30/50 curable resin = = 10677-80 Stage 4 - Lower Mesaverde

oated sand, 1,62I bbls FR slick water = = 10774-76 Stage 4 - Lower Mesaverde
= 10836-39 Stage 4 - Lower Mesaverde
= 10922-25 Stage 4 - Lower Mesaverde

Stage 4: 897 bbis of 20# linear and Borate XL gel and
(7/26/06) 24,000 # 20/40 white sand,5000# 20/40 Versa

rop. 49,000# Temp DC sand = 10998-11101 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde
= 11023-26 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde
= 11095-98 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde

Stage 3: ybrid frac well w/ 3199 bbls20#1iner and = 11288-91 Stage 3 - Lower Mesaverde
(7/26/06) orate XL fluid and I 18,000# 20/40 Ottawa

and,15.000#20/40 Versa prop, 48,000# Temp
C sand = 11897-99 Stage 2 - Desert/Grassy

IIP

• = 11936-38 Stage 2 - Desert/Grassy
Stage 2: 1450 bbis IS#XL gel and 66,000# 20/40 versa

a = 11965-68 Stage 2 - Desert/Grassy
(7/25/06) rop sand

= 12040-43 Stage 2 - Desert/Grassy

* = 12545-52 Stage 1 - Spring Canyon
Stage 1: I300# 20-40 Versaprop and 48000# 20-40
(6/29/06) agnaprop, using 2406 bb1s 25 and 20# Borate 3-3/4" Bit x POBS (8/10/06) (5/27/2010)

L gel

PBTD @ 12552' (5/28/2010)
MD 12,756
TD 12,756

RECEIVED June 16,



STATEOF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Gasco Production Co OperatorAccount Number: N 2575

Address: 8 Invemess Drive East, Ste 100

city Englewood

state Co zip 80112 Phone Number: (303) 483-0044

Well 1

API Number Well Name OG Sec Twp Rng County
4304736740 Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18 NESW 25 9 18 Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number Effective Date
'

15213 15213 2/22/2006
Comments Formation Change from MVRDto WSMVD

wellÁPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

well
PI Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Estabilsh new entityfor new well (single well only) Jessica Be
B - Add new well to existîngentity (groupor unit well) Na
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity toanother existingentity g 4D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Si na ure
E - Other(Explainin'comments'section) RECEIVED cdonTech 7/23/2010

Date

mooo> JUL2 62010

STATEOF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Gasco Production Co OperatorAccount Number: N 2575

Address: 8 Invemess Drive East, Ste 100

city Englewood

state Co zip 80112 Phone Number: (303) 483-0044

Well 1

API Number Well Name OG Sec Twp Rng County
4304736740 Sheep Wash Federal 23-25-9-18 NESW 25 9 18 Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number Effective Date
'

15213 15213 2/22/2006
Comments Formation Change from MVRDto WSMVD

wellÁPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

well
PI Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Estabilsh new entityfor new well (single well only) Jessica Be
B - Add new well to existîngentity (groupor unit well) Na
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity toanother existingentity g 4D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Si na ure
E - Other(Explainin'comments'section) RECEIVED cdonTech 7/23/2010

Date

mooo> JUL2 62010



API Well No: 43047367400000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-9803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2052 FSL 1932 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

10/15/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco would like to dispose of water at LaPoint Recycle & Storage state
approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 12 Township 5 south
Range 19 west in LaPoint UT. This facility would be used in addition to the

currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water from
this well.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Roger Knight 303 996-1803

TITLE
 EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/8/2010

October 08, 2010

October 11, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047367400000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE3DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

2052 FSL 1932 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at LaPoint Recycle & Storage state
approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 12 Township 5 soutAccepted by the

Range 19 west in LaPoint UT. This facility would be used in addition to the Utah Division of
currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water fDIT Gas and Mining

this well. FOR REÇggggY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/8/2010

RECEIVED October 08,

iPI Well No: 43047367400000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE3DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

2052 FSL 1932 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at LaPoint Recycle & Storage state
approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 12 Township 5 soutAccepted by the

Range 19 west in LaPoint UT. This facility would be used in addition to the Utah Division of
currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water fDIT Gas and Mining

this well. FOR REÇggggY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/8/2010

RECEIVED October 08,



API Well No: 43047367400000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-9803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2052 FSL 1932 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

1/1/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in addition
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of

water from this well.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/31/2010

December 31, 2010

01/05/2011

iPI Well No: 43047367400000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE3DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

2052 FSL 1932 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,

iPI Well No: 43047367400000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE3DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367400000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

2052 FSL 1932 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NESW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only 

Effective Date· 4/16/2015 
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERA TOR: 
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265 
7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237 
303-996-1805 303-996-1805 

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV 

WELL INFORMATION: 
Well Name API 
See Attached List 

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION: 
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015 
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015 
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143 

REVIEW: 
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: 
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015 
4. OPS/SIITA welles) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1120/2016 
5. VIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A 
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None 
7. Inspections ofPA statelfee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION: 
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 

2. Indian welles) covered by Bond Number: 
3.State/fee welles) covered by Bond Number(s): 

DATA ENTRY: 

1. Welles) update in the OGIS on: 

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 

3. Unites) operator number update in OGIS on: 
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: 
5. StatelFee welles) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION: 

SUR0027842 
N/A 
SUR0027845 
SUR0035619 -FCB 

1122/2016 
1122/2016 
1122/2016 
N/A 
1122/2016 
N/A 

N/A 
6/2/2015 

N/A 

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division 
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1122/2016 
COMMENTS: 

1/22/2016 

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265
7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237
303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUROO27842
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUROO27845

SUROO35619-FCB

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 1/22/2016
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 1/22/2016
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016
COMMENTS:



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

Well Name -
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 

-------
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 
FEDERAL 31-21 G-9-19 
Federal 323-29-9-19 
Federal 421-29-9-19 
Federal 322-29-9-1 9 
Federal 43 1 -29-9-1 9 
Federal 432-29-9-1 9 
Federal 414-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 

.. _--

-----_._- -
federal 321-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 
Federal 212-29-9-19 
State 321-32-9-19 
State 423-32-9-19 
State 421-32-9-19 
State 413-32-9-1 9 
State 323-32-9-1 9 
State 431-32-9-19 ---
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 

-
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-1 0-1 7 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-1 1-16 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 

-----
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 
SQUA W CROSSING U 5 
RBU 5-lID -
FEDERAL 7-25A 

Section 
18 
17 
18 
29 
20 
21 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
36 
36 
36 
30 
29 
23 
26 
19 
17 
21 
32 
20 
17 
19 
32 
4 
32 
29 
16 
16 
29 
8 
16 
20 
20 
4 
22 
24 
2 
11 

------

25 

TWN 'RNG API Number Enti!Y 
090S 190E 4304752496 
090S 190E 4304752522 
090S 190E 4304752538 ' 
090S 190E 4304752544 

. '.' 

090S 190E 4304752545 
090S 190E 4304752546 
090S 190E 4304753026 
090S 190E 4304753027 
090S 190E 4304753029 ; 
090S 190E 4304753030 
090S 190E 4304753031 i 
090S 190E 4304753070 
090S 190E 4304753073 
090S 190E 4304753076 
090S 190E 4304753078 
090S 190E 4304753079 , 
090S 190E 4304753080 
090S 190E 4304753133 1 
090S 190E 4304754479 
090S 190E 4304754480 
090S 190E 4304754481 
090S 190E 4304754482 ! 

090S 190E 4304754483 
090S 190E 4304754529 
090S 180E 4304754541 
090S 180E 4304754542 
090S 180E 4304754543 
090S 190E 4304753012 19650 
100S 170E 4301333098 15941 
090S 190E 4304736915 16556 
090S 180E 4304738573 17201 
090S 190E 4304739777 18344 
O9OS 190E 4304739800 17202 
1I0S 150E 4301332391 13787 
100S 170E 4301332447 14033 
1l0S 150E 4301332475 14417 
100S 170E 4301332560 -14726 
1l0S 160E 4301332611 14439 
100S ,170E 4301332619 15649 
11 OS 170E 4301332674 15537 

' 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 
100S 170E 4301332679 14033 
1I0S 150E 4301332685 16082 
100S 170E 4301332730 15243 
100S 170E 4301332773 15370 
1I0S 170E 4301332778 14802 
1I0S 160E 4301332888 15098 
100S 170E 4301333081 15714 
100S 1 70E '4301333087 i 15807 
11 OS 170E 4301333099 ' 15920 
1I0S 140E 4301333437 16919 
1I0S ,140E 4301333443 16367 
100S 180E 4304730129 16266 
100S ! 180E 4304730409 9005 

I 

090S 180E I4304730624 19030 

Mineral Surface Type Status 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal 'GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 

---
Federal Federal GW APD 
'Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
Federal Federal GW DRL 

--

Federal Federal GW OPS 
Fee Fee GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal ,GW OPS 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P ---
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Eederal GW P 

.. -

Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State 'OW P 
Federal Federal OW P --
Federal Federal OW P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

WellName Section TWN RNGAPINumber Entity Mineral Surface TypeiStatus
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304752522 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752538 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304752544 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304752545 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304752546 Federal Federal OW APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753026 Federal_ Federal GW APD
Federa1421-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753027 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753029 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1431-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753030 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753031 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1414-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753070 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753073 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753076 Federal Federal GW APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753078 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753079 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753080 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753133 Federal Federal GW APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754479 State State GW APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754480 State State GW APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754481 State State GW APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754482 State State GW APD

te 323-32-9-19 32 0908 190E 4304754483 State State GW APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754529 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754541 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754542 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754543 State State GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 1108 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State_ State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-l l-17 4 110S 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-ll-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 l10S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 l10S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW P
RBU 5-11D 11 l00S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU6-2D 
NGC 33-18J 
RBU 13-2D 

2 
18 
2 

-.-------~--~~----~~--

RBU 16-3D 3 
-----

RBU 1O-1lD 11 
RBU 8-10D 10 
RBU 15-3D 3 
RBU 12-12D 12 
RBU2-10D 10 
RBU 3-15D 15 
RBU 3-12D 12 

--

STATE 7-36A 36 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 
STATE4-32B 32 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 
L YTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 

--

FED 11-21-9-19 21 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 

- -

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 

----
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 

-~ ~--

DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 

--
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 

- --_._--

DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 

-
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 

100S 180EI4304731190 7075 State State OW P 
090S 190E:4304731200 16155 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180Ei4304731280 16267 State State OW P 

----

100S 180E 14304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 1180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 

-+-- ---- c----
100S 1180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
100S ~~304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180EI4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 14304731801 110784 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW IP 
090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 14304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734169 14140 'Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734202 113455 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P 
100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170EI4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734607 :13640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E:4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P 

-~ 

090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735405 114928 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW IP 
090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E!4304735623 i 14640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P 
090S 190E4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P 
100S 180E'4304735808 !15592 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 190E 4304735844 114356 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P 
090S 190E 14304736093 i 14976 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P ---f----

090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P 
090S 180E!4304736220 14763 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P +---
090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P 
090S 190E '4304736271 115884 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P 

---
090S 190E !4304736442 .15715 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E ;4304736600 ! 14977 Federal Federal GW P 
090S I 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW ,P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU6i-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State ONV P
14GiC33-18J 18 090S 190E ‡304731200 6155 Federal Federal DNV P
FU3U13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State CA¥ P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
FU3tJ 10-111) 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal ()VV P
FU3t] 8-10L) 10 100S 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal ()?V JP
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU2-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federed Federed Cygr p
IUBU3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federed Federed CA¥ P
FU3U3-12D 12 100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federed Federal OMT P
STATE7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 Sutte Smte GMT P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFLAL23-29#l 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FE]D44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federed (ITV P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FEI342-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GYV P
PETESM'ASH23-12#1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federed Federal GNV P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FEl3 14-18-2 #1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Fedenal Federal GB¥ P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FEI3 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GVV P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFDAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Fedenal Feden11 GMT P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEE)EFLAL41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Feden11 (39V P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P
LikNIB TItUST24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GMT P
FEEIEftAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E =‡304735808 15592 Federal Federal (39V P
FEDERAL21-6-10-19 6 100S 190E 4304735844 14356 Federed Federed GNV P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STitTE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GVV P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEEIEftAL23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 43047369‡42 15715 Federal Federal (svV P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 
-----

FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 
~HEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 -----_ .. _. __ ._--

FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 

--

----------.. -------

----_. __ . __ ._----_._._._._ .... -

FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 
----------

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 

125 090S 180E i4304736727 '15475 Federal Federal 
--

30 090S 190E'4304736739 !15476 Federal Federal 
-------
25 090S 180E'4304736740 15213 Federal Federal 
19 090S 190E 14304736771 

-----

15355 Federal Federal 
-- , -

~L ____ f?90S :180EI4304736772 15338 Federal Federal 
f-----'---+---

30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal 
--

22 090S 190E 14304736913 15187 Fee Fee 
- -- ------- - -- ----f-------

LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E:4304736916 : 17012 Fee Fee --_._----

DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180Ei4304737115 115011 State State 
.... __ .. _._---_.--- -_ .. --------

FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 '090S .190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal 

.--------- -- 1--

UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 14304737132 15087 i State State 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E i4304737338 ! 15365 State State 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E :4304737611 116311 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S i 190E!4304737612 16051 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 119OE[4304737613 16052 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S '190E:4304737621 16253 !Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E I4304737622 16264 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E :4304737630 16557 Federal Federal 
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E

'
4304737631 15961 Federal Federal 

~ 

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 1180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S : 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E !430473767616254 iState State 

----

180E4304737677h5806 State UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S State 
---- c---

UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S ,180E'4304738028 16868 State State 
-- 1-----

FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S ',190E 4304738336 116467 Federal Federal 
1-------

190E 4304738337 116119 IFederal Federal FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S --------------f-----

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E4304738351 16884 Federal Federal 
--- -

180E~4304738352 ~~ WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 16349 Federal Federal _.-----

SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E [4304738353 16210 Federal Federal 
-

FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S : 190E 4304738407 ; 16236 Federal Federal 
--

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E!4304738465 16558 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180EI4304738469 16449 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal 
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S ,190E 4304738673 : 15832 Fee Fee 
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S 180E4304738896 16792 Federal Federal 
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E:4304739170 16309 State State 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S : 190EI4304739171 16308 State State 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 1 190E 4304739172 116310 State State 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E!4304739717 17054 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E,4304739729 17241 Federal Federal -
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 ! 17266 Federal Federal 

. -------. 
4304739773 -: 17013 ,Federal DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E Federal .... -.--_ ..... -

FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E4304740233 17014 Federal Federal 
- - - -

FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E:4304751280 18211 Federal Federal ---------------c------ c---
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190Ei4304751281 18210 Federal Federal 

----f----
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S : 190E 4304752870_1~64? IFederal Federal -------------------r--------- c----

~~~~~~ !;~:~~:~:! ~ 30 090S 190E14304752872 19648 Federal Federal --_ .. __ .. 
30 090S 190E ;4304753011 19649 Federal Federal 

- --1----------
180E 14304753324 '19783 Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S State State 

Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 : 180E 14304753325 36 090S 19783 State State 
--- --

Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S '180E 4304753326 19747 State State 
Desert SI>ring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E '4304753327 119747 State State 

-- _ ... 

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E :4304753328 119783 State State 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S i 170E 4301332677 ! 15144 State State 
RBU 4-11D III 100S 180E :4304730718 16269 Federal Federal 

GW P 
--

GW P 
-~-. 

GW P 
GW P 
GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
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From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-l l-10-18 11 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State_ GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
RBU4-llD ll 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU2-llD 
~---- --
RBU 6-llD 
STATE2-32B c--
STATE 9-36A 
FEDERAL 13-30B 
STATE 13-36A 
FEDERAL 16-26A 

II ._-- -------

II 
32 

1

36 
30 

-----~---

36 
126 

------------------+-----

FEDERAL 31-29 129 
RBU I-IOD :10 ----------------------_.- I 

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 i 18 

100S 180E 4304730826 116270 Federal Federal OW S 
------- ------ 1-------

100S 180E4304731192 16271 .Federal Federal OW S -+---- --
090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 

-090S1180E 4304732225 il1364 
---

State State IGW S 
090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
090S il80E 4304733598 17838 State State IGW S 
090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
090S ! 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
100S 1180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW .S 
090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal iGW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-l lD 11 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S
STATE 2-32B 32 '090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE 9-36A 36 _ _090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significanUy deepen existing wells below current boItom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drlH horizontal laterals. Use APPLlCA TION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for sUCh proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OILWELL 0 GAS WELL IlJ OTHER __________ _ 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Gasco Production Company 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

7979 E. Tufts Ave. 

4. LOCATIONOFWELL 

CITY Denver 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL 

STATE CO zIP80237 

QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWJIISHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S 

I PHONE NUMBER: 

(303) 483-0044 

UTU-76482 
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UMT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18 
9. API NUMBER: 

4304737631 
10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: 

Uteland Butte 

COUNTY: Uintah 

STATE: 
UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

rlI 0 ACIDIZE 0 DEEPEN 0 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(SubmH in Duplicate) 0 ALTER CASING 0 FRACTURE TREAT 0 SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work wil start: 0 CASING REPAIR 0 NEW CONSTRUCTION 0 TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

4/16/2015 0 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE 0 TUBING REPAIR 

0 CHANGE TUBING 0 PLUG AND ABANDON 0 VENT OR FLARE 

0 SUBSEQUENT REPORT 0 CHANGE WELL NAME 0 PLUG BACK 0 WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

0 CHANGE WELL STATUS 0 PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) 0 WATER SHUT-OFF 
Date of work completion: 

0 COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS 0 RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 0 OTHER: 

0 CONVERT WELL TYPE 0 RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator 01:1 this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco 
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/1612015. 

Gasco Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

Badlands Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui ~ 15 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

(512000) 

TITLE 

DATE 

(See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

RECEIVED 
JUN 0 2 2015 

DIV OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

Engineering Tech 

511812015 

APPROVE 
JAN 22 2016 

~.oIL_ GAS & MINING ... 

BY:~Ch.Jt9 rn~cLU'\~ 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-76482

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill newwells,significantlydeepen exislingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TODRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL O GASWELL OTHER Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

7979 E. Tufts Ave CITY
Denver STATE CO ZIP 80237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL COUNTY: Uintah

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FR^CTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

4/16/2015 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUGAND ABANDON O VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME O PLUGBACK O WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) O WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE O OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly show allpertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on thiswell, in additionto thewells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effectivedate of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 1
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

Michael Decker, Exec. Vi President & COO !)EC61VEL
Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui 15 JUN0 2 205
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

DIVOFOiL,GAS&MINING
Michael Decker, Exec. Vic PreWent&COO

NAME (PLEASE PRIN Lindsey Cooke TITLE Engineering Tech

SIGNATURE DATE 5/18/2015

(Thisspacefo Stateuseonly) APPROVED
JAN2 2 2016

(5/2000) (seeinstruolinsonReverseSide) IV.OlL GAS &



Well Name Section TWN RNO API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal OW DRL 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal OW OPS 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 O9OS 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee OW OPS 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S lSOE 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal OW OPS 
OATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 II OS 150E 4301332391 13787 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332447 14033 State State OW P 
OATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 II OS 150E 4301332475 14417 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 lOOS 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 II OS 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332619 15649 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 4 llOS 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332676 15242 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 lOOS l70E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 llOS 150E 4301332685 16082 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 lOOS 170E 4301332730 15243 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 llOS l70E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 llOS 160E 4301332888 15098 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333087 15S07 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 II OS 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 II OS 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 II OS 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 5-IID II lOOS 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 O9OS 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU6-2D 2 lOOS 180E 430473ll9O 7075 State State OW P 
NOC33-18J 18 O9OS 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 13-20 2 lOOS 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P 
RBU 16-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU IO-IID II lOOS 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU8-IOD 10 l00s 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 15-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 12-120 12 lOOS lSOE 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU2-IOD 10 lOOS 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-15D 15 lOOS 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-12D 12 lOOS 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE7-36A 36 O9OS 180E 4304733741 14244 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 lOOS 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734ll1 13441 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 O9OS 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 O9OS 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal OW P 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 lOOS 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE4-32B 32 O9OS 190E 4304734314 14440 State State OW P 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 lOOS 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 lOOS l70E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal OW P 
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 lOOS lSOE 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 O9OS 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal OW P 

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKINRIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 1005 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 0905 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 1908 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED l2-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE 32-08 8 110S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
RBU5-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 6-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State OW P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P
RBU 16-3D 3 1005 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 8-10D 10 1005 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 1005 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 2-l0D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-12D 12 1005 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 0905 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 0908 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal GW P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GW P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 4-32B 32 0908 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FED 14-18-2#1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FED I 1-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 0905 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW



FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee OW P 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 lOOS 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 lOOS 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 41-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304735845 14639 State State OW P 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 O9OS 190E 4304735995 14871 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 23-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736219 14738 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 21-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736220 14763 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 12-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736233 14764 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 43-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736241 14992 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 O9OS 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 33-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304737115 15011 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 O9OS 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737132 15087 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737338 15365 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO FED 21-1-10-18 I l00s 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 I lOOS 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737676 16254 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737677 15806 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304738028 16868 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal OW P 

FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 0908 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 0903 190E 4304735732 144% Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 0908 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 1005 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 0908 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 0905 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 0905 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 0905 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 0905 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 1005 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 0905 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW



LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P 
UTELAND FED 42-1 1-10-18 II 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P 
STATE21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 Slale Stale GW P 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 Slale State GW P 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P 
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P 
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P 
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State Stale GW P 
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 Slate Slale GW P 
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P 
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P 
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 Slale Stale GW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S 
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 Slale Slale OW S 
RBU 4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU2-11D II 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S 
STATE 2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 Slale State GW S 
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S 
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
RBU 1-100 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S 
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW S 

LAMBTRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 1005 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 0905 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 43047397\7 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED I 1-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 I 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert SpringsState 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
DesertSpring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
SQUAW CROSSING US 2 1005 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW S
RBU4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Fedem! Fedeml ONV S
RBU2-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304730826 16270 Fedeml Fedeml CAV S
RBU6-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304731192 16271 Fedem! Fedeml OAV S
STATE2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 0905 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW
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