
PERilITC0
UlfPAÑ

14421 County Rd. 10 • Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621 • (303) 857-9999 • FAX(303) 857-0577 • E-MAIL Permitco l@aol com

May17,2005

DivisionofOil,Gas &Mining
1594West NorthTemple,Suite1210
Box145801
SaltLakeCity,UT 84114-5801

Re: GascoProduction Company
SheepWash Federal#21-25-9-18
521' FNLand2122'FWL
NENWSection25,T9S- R18E
UintahCounty,Utah
Lease No.U-9803

Gentlemen:

Enclosed please find two copies of the Applicationfor Permit to Drill,alongwithone copyof the
Onshore Order No.1 whichwas filedwiththe BLMinVernal,Utah.

Ifyoushouldneedadditionalinformation,please don't hesitate tocontactme. Approvedcopiesofthe
A.P.D.shouldbe sent to Permitco Inc.at the addressshown above.

Sincerely,

Venessa Langmacher
Consultant for
GascoProduction Company

Enc. RECElVED
MAYJ 9 2005cc: Gasco Production Company - Englewood,CO

Shawn Elworthy- Roosevelt, UT DIV.0FOlL,GAS&
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT Ü
ÛÛ1 (highlight changes)

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
UM ERALLEASENO.: 6. SURMFACE:

1A. TYPEOFWORK: DRILL Ë REENTER O DEEPEN O 7. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

N/A
B. TYPE OF WELL: OILO GAS OTHER SINGLEZONEEl MULTIPLEZONE 8. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company Sheep Wash Federal21-25-9-18 go
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

8 Inverness DriveEast, Suite100, Englewood,CO80112 303/483-0044 & $ g N) y Ç\Af Ñ°'
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, OWNSHIP, RANGE

MERID1AN:

ATSURFACE: 521' FNLand2122'FWL6/929 Section 25,T9S - R18E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: NENw //0, 00'7

14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: î3. STATE:

Approximately23.8 miles southeast ofMyton,UT Uintah UT
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASS1GNED TO THIS WELL:

521' 1400.01 40 Acres
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET):

Approx.1100' 13,036' Bond No.UT-1233
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:

4922' GL ASAP 35 Days

24. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YlELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT

17-1/2" 13-3/8",H-40,48# 170' 225sx PremiumType 5, 15.6ppg,1.18yield
12-1/4" 8-5/8", J-55, 32# ,3,479' 580 sx Hi-Lift,11 ppg, 3.91 yield+ 185 sx 10-2 RFC,14.2 ppg, 1.63 yield
7-7/8" 4-1/2", P-110,13.5# 13,036' 366 sx Hi-Lift,11.5ppg, 3.05yield + 1753sx 50-50Poz, 14.1ppg, 1.28yield

cut*WW GHTHOLE

25 ATTACHMENTS
VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH O1LAND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLATOR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN(¯]
EVIDENCE OF DIVIS10N OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

AGENT: PermitCoInc., 14421CountyRoad 10,Fort Lupton,CO80621 AGENT'S PHONE NO.: 303/857-9999

NAME (PLEASE P T) VenOSsa angmacher TITLE Agent ÍOr Gasco Production Company

SIGNATURE DATE May17,2005
(This space for State use only)

API NUMBER ASSIGNED: R
Ltne i RECE IVED

Utah Division of

(11/2001) DIV.0F0 L,

G9AS

&
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GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
1910 Bross Cop. T9S R18 E, S. L.B. &M. m is2.0' High, Pile

E E Well location, SHEEP WASH FEDERAL°,'of °"""
""NB9 42'48"W - 2641.24' (Meas.) NB9°46'40"W

- 2640.66' (Meas.) .#21-25- 9-18, located as shown in the NE 1/4A L

19/Û STOSS Cop, STUSS Û¤p, ' ' NW 1/4 of Section 25, T9S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.o.r sign, stones ';j ";"" Uintah County, Utah.

2122 BASIS OF ELEVATIONSHEEP WASHEEDERAL
SPOT ELEVATIONLOCATED AT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF/21-25-9-18
SECTION 31, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE MOON

Elev. Ungraded Ground = 4922' BOTTOM, QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE
QUAD. (TOPOGRAPH1C MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED
STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY.
SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 4838 FEET.

N
1910 Brass Cop, 1910 Brass Cap,1.1' High, Steel 0.6' High, Pi/ePost of Stones

o o o

SCALE

CERTIFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE,ABOVl¯ PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THEZ.SAMEARE TRUE AND CORRECTTO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BELlE

1910 Brass Cap, Set Marked Stone, Brass Cap, REGlSTEREDLAND SURVEYOR0.6' High, Pile 1.5' High, P//e of 2.J' High, Pile RE0ISTRATION NO. 16Ò19of Stones Stones of Stones
STATE OF UTAH

NB9'47'21"W - 2642.95' (Meos.) SB9°39'49"E
- 2641.94' (Meas.)

BASIS OF BEARINGs UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

(435) 789-1017
LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUS NAD 83) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRÃWN:LATITUDE = 40°00'27.79" (40.007719) 1" = 1000' 04-13-05 04-27-05

=
90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE = 109°50'37.90" (109.843861) PARTY REFERENCES(AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) 8.8 J.M P.M G.L.O. PLAT= PROPOSED WELL HEAD· LATITUDE= 40°00'27.92" (40.007756)

WEATHER FILELONGITUDE=
109°50'35.38"

(109.843161)a = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED·
COOL GASCO PRODUCTION
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CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1

Approvalof Operations on Onshore
Federal and IndianOil&Gas Leases

Sheep Wash Federal#21-25-9-18
521' FNLand 2122' FWL

NENWSection 25, T9S-R18E
UintahCounty,Utah

Prepared For:

Gasco Production Company

By:

PERMITCOINC.
14421CountyRoad 10

Ft. Lupton,Colorado 80621 '

303/857-9999

Copies Sent To:

3 - Bureauof Land Management- Vernal,UT 44 Po

UtahDivisionofOil,Gas &Mining- SLC,UT J >
2 - Gasco Production Company- Englewood,CO
1 - Shawn Elworthy- Roosevelt, UT yPEIL

CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1

Approvalof Operations on Onshore
Federal and IndianOil&Gas Leases

Sheep Wash Federal#21-25-9-18
521' FNLand 2122' FWL

NENWSection 25, T9S-R18E
UintahCounty,Utah

Prepared For:

Gasco Production Company

By:

PERMITCOINC.
14421CountyRoad 10

Ft. Lupton,Colorado 80621
'

303/857-9999

Copies Sent To:

3 - Bureauof Land Management- Vernal,UT 44 Po

UtahDivisionofOil,Gas &Mining- SLC,UT J >
2 - Gasco Production Company- Englewood,CO
1 - Shawn Elworthy- Roosevelt, UT yPEIL



APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODR. . ORREENTER

24. Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Attached.

2. A Drilling Plan
See DrillingProgramAttached.

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the SUPO shall be filed with the Appropriate Forest
Service Office.

See SurfaceUse Plan Attached.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see Item 20).
Bond coveragefor thiswell is provided by Gasco Production Company under theirBLMBond No.UT-1233.

5. Operator certification.

Please be advised thatGascoProduction Company is consideredto be the operator of the abovementioned well.
Gasco Production Company agreesto be responsibleunder the termsandconditionsof the lease for the operations
conducted upon the leased lands.

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the authorized
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ONSHOREORDERNO.1 ANFlDENTIAL - TlGHTHOLE
GascoProductionCompany
Sheep Wash Federal #21-25-9-18 Lease No.U-9803
521'FNLand 2122'FWL
NENWSection25,T9S-Ri8E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 1

ONSHOREOlL&GASORDERNO.1
ApprovalofOperations on Onshore

Federal and IndianOiland Gas Leases

Allleaseand/orunitoperationswillbeconductedinsucha mannerthatfullcomplianceismadewithapplicable
laws, regulations(43CFR3100), OnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1, andtheapprovedplanofoperations.The
operatoris fullyresponsiblefortheactionsofhis subcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe furnished
thefieldrepresentativeto insurecompliance.

1. ESTIMATEDTOPSOFIMPORTANTGEOLOGICMARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea

Uinta Surface +4,921'

Wasatch 5,431' -495'

Mesaverde . 9,286' -4,350'

Castlegate 11,836' -6,900'

Blackhawk 12,036' -7,100'

SpringCanyon 12,736' -7,800'

T.D. 13,036' -8,100'

2. ESTIMATEDDEPTHOFANTICIPATEDWATER,OIL,GASORMINERALFORMATIONS:

Substance Formation Depth

Gas Wasatch 5,900'-9,286'

Gas Mesaverde 9,286'-11,836'

Gas Blackhawk 12,036'-12,950'

Allfreshwaterprospectivelyvaluablemineralsencounteredduringdrilling,willbe recorded
by depth and adequatelyprotected. All oiland gas shows willbe testedto determine
commercialpotential.
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ONSHOREORDERNO.1 -JNFlDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GascoProductionCompany
Sheep Wash Federal #21-25-9-18 Lease No.U-9803
521' FNLand 2122' FWL
NENWSection25, T9S-R18E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 2

3. PRESSURECONTROLEQUIPMENT

GascoProductionCompany'sminimumspecificationsforpressurecontrolequipmentare as follows:

RamType: 11" Hydraulicdoublewithannular,5000psiw.p.

Ramtypepreventersandassociatedequipmentshallbe testedtoapprovedstackworkingpressure
if isolatedby testplugor to 70 percent of internalyieldpressure ofcasing. Pressure shallbe
maintainedforat least 10 minutesoruntilrequirementsoftestare met,whicheveris longer. Ifa test
plugisutilized,no bleed-offpressure isacceptable.Fora testnotutilizinga testplug,ifa declinein
pressureofmorethan10 percentin30 minutesoccurs,thetestshallbe consideredto havefailed.
Valveoncasinghead belowtestplugshallbe openduringtestofBOPstack.

Annulartypepreventers(ifused)shallbe testedto50 percentofratedworkingpressure. Pressure
shallbe maintainedat least 10 minutesor untilprovisionsoftestare met,whicheveris longer.

Asa minimum,theabove testshallbe performed:

a. when initiallyinstalled;
b. wheneveranysealsubjecttotestpressureis broken
c. followingrelatedrepairs;and
d. at 30-day intervals

Valvesshallbe testedfromworkingpressure sideduringBOPEtestswithalldownstreamvalves
open.

Whentestingthekilllinevalve(s)thecheckvalveshallbe heldopenortheballremoved.

Annularpreventersshallbe functionallyoperatedat leastweekly.

Pipeandblindramsshallbe activatedeachtrip,however,thisfunctionneed notbe performedmore
thanonce a day.

ABOPEpitleveldrillshallbe conductedweeklyforeachdrillingcrew.

Pressure testsshallapplytoallrelatedwellcontrolequipment.

Alloftheabovedescribedtestsand/ordrillsshallbe recordedinthedrillinglog.
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ONSHOREORDERNO.1 ANFlDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GascoProductionCompany
Sheep Wash Federal#21-25-9-18 Lease No.U-9803
521' FNLand 2122' FWL
NENWSection25, T9S-Ri8E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 3

BOPsystemsshallbe consistentwithAPIRP53. Pressuretestswillbe conductedbeforedrillingout
fromundercasingstringswhichhave been set and cementedinplace. Blowoutpreventercontrols
willbe installedpriortodrillingthesurfacecasingplugandwillremaininuse untilthewelliscompleted
orabandoned.Preventerswillbe inspectedand operatedat leastdailytoensure goodmechanical
workingorder,and thisinspectionwillbe recordedonthedailydrillingreport. Preventerswillbe
pressuretestedbeforedrillingcasingcementplugs.

TheDistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientleadtime,inordertohávetheBLMrepresentative
on locationduringpressuretesting.

a. ThesizeandratingoftheBOPstackisshownontheattacheddiagram.Althougha righas
notbeenchosentodrillthiswell,mostoftheequipmentforthisdeþthofholeinthearea use
a 11",5000 psiworkingpressureblowoutpreventor.

b. Achokelineand a killlineareto be properlyinstalled. The killlineis .not to be used as a
fill-upline.

c. Theaccumulatorsystemshallhavea pressurecapacitytoprovideforrepeatedoperationof
hydraulicpreventers.

d. Drillstringsafetyvalve(s),tofitalltoolsinthedrillstring,aretobe maintainedontherigfloor
whiledrillingoperationsare inprogress.

4. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM:

a. The proposedcasingandcementingprogramshallbe conductedas approvedtoprotect
and/or isolate all usablewaterzones, potentiallyproductivezones, lost circulationzones,
abnormallypressured zones, and anyprospectivelyvaluabledeposits of minerals.Any
isolatingmediumotherthancementshallreceiveapprovalpriortouse. Thecasingsetting
depthshallbe calculatedtopositionthecasingseat oppositea competentformationwhich
willcontainthe maximumpressure to which it willbe exposedduring normal drilling
operations.Determinationofcasingsettingdepth shall be based on all relevantfactors,
including;presencelabsence of hydrocarbons;fracture gradients; usable water zones;
formationpressures;lostcirculationzones;otherminerals;orotherunusualcharacteristics.
Allindicationsofusablewatershallbe reported.
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b. Casingdesignshallassume formationpressure gradientsof0.44 to 0.50 psi per foot for
exploratorywells(lackingbetterdata).

c. Casingdesignshallassumefracturegradientsfrom0.70to1.00psiperfootforexploratory
wells(lackingbetterdata)

d. Casingcollarsshallhavea minimumclearanceof0.422 inchesofallsidesinthehole/casing
annulus,withrecognitionthatvariancescan be grantedforjustifiedexceptions.

e. Allwaitingoncementtimesshallbe adequatetoachievea minimumof500psicompressive
strengthat thecasingshoe priortodrillingout.

f. Allcasingexcepttheconductorcasing,shallbe neworreconditionedandtestedusedcasing
thatmeetsorexceedsAPIstandardsfornewcasing.

g. Thesurfacecasingshallbe cementedbacktosurfaceeitherduringtheprimarycementjob
or byremedialcementing.

h. Allindicationsofusable water shallbe reportedtotheauthorizedofficerpriorto runningthe
nextstringofcasingorbeforepluggingordersare requested,whicheveroccursfirst.

i. Threecentralizerswillbe runonthebottomthreejointsofsurfacecasingwitha minimumof
one centralizerperjointstartingwiththeshoe joint.

j. Topplugsshallbe used toreducecontaminationofcementbydisplacementfluid.Abottom
plugor otheracceptabletechnique,suchas a suitablepreflushfluid,innerstringcement
method,etc.shallbe utilizedtohelpisolatethecementfromcontaminationbythemudfluid
beingdisplacedaheadofthecementslurry.

k. Allcasingstringsbelowtheconductorshallbe pressuretestedto0.22psiperfootofcasing
stringlengthor1500 psi,whicheverisgreater,but nottoexceed70 percentoftheminimum
internalyield.Ifpressuredeclinesmorethan10 percentin30minutes,correctiveactionshall
be taken.

l. Onallexploratorywells,and on thatportionofanywellapprovedfora 5MBOPEsystemor
greater,a pressure integritytestofeach casingshoeshallbe performed.Formationat the
shoeshallbe testedtoa minimumofthe mudweightequivalentanticipatedto controlthe
formationpressureto thenextcasingdepthorat totaldepthofthewell. Thistestshallbe
performedbeforedrillingmorethan20 feetofnewhole. « rag

PElk
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m. Theproposedcasingprogramwillbe as follows:

Purpose Depth HoleSize O.D. Weight Grade Type New/Used

Conductor 0-170' 17-1/2" 13-3/8" 48# H-40 - - - New

Surface 0-3,479' 12-1/4" 8-5/8" 32# J-55 ST&C New

Production 0-13,036' 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 LT&C New

n. Casingdesignsubjecttorevisionbased ongeologicconditionsencountered.

o. Thecementprogramwillbe as follows:

Conductor Typeand Amount

O'- 170' 225 sx PremiumType5 @15.6 ppg, 1.18cuft/skyield

Surface TypeandAmount

TOC@Surface Lead:580sxHi-Lift@11 ppg,3.91cuft/sk yield
Tail:185 sx 10-2RFC@14.2 ppg, 1.63 cuft/skyield

Production Typeand Amount

TOC@2,500' Lead:366sxHi-Lift@11.5ppg,3.05cuft/skyield
Tail:1753sx50:50Poz @14.1ppg,1.28 cuft/skyield

p. Anticipatedcementtopswillbe reportedas to depth;nottheexpectednumberof sacksof
cementtobe used. The DistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientleadtime,inorder
tohavea BLMrepresentativeon locationwhilerunningallcasingstringsandcementing.

q. Aftercementingbutbeforecommencinganytest,thecasingstringshallstandcementeduntil
thecementhas reacheda compressivestrengthofat least500psiattheshoe. WOCtime
shallbe recordedinthedriller'slog.

r. Thefollowingreportsshallbe filedwiththeDistrictManagerwithin30 daysaftertheworkis
completed.

PERilITC0
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1. Progress reports,Form3160-5(formerly9-331)"SundryNoticesand Reportson
Wells",mustincludecompleteinformationconcerning:

a. Settingofeachstringofcasing,showingthesize,grade, weightofcasing
set, holesize,settingdepth,amountsand typeof cement used, whether
cement circulatedor the top ofthe cement behindthe casing, depth of
cementingtoolsused, casingtest methodand results,and the date work
was done. Showthespuddate on thefirstreportssubmitted.

b. Temperatureorbondlogsmustbe submittedforeach wellwherethecasing
cementwas notcirculatedtothesurface.

s. Auxiliaryequipmenttobe used is as follows:

1. Kellycock
2. Nobitfloatis deemednecessary.
3. Asubwitha fullopeningvalve.

5. MUDPROGRAM

a. The proposedcirculatingmediumstobe employedindrillingare as follows:

Interval Mud Type MudWt. Visc. F/L PH

O'-170' FreshWater 8.33 1 - - - 7

170'-3,479' FreshWater 8.33 1 - - - 7-8

3,479'-13,036' FreshWater&DAP 9.0-11.5 30-40 12-20 8

Therewillbe sufficientmudon locationtocontrola blowoutshouldoneoccur.
Amudtestshallbe performedevery24 hoursaftermuddinguptodetermine,as applicable:
density,viscosity,gelstrength,staticfiltrationloss,andPh.

b. Mudmonitoringequipmenttobe used isas follows:

1. Periodiccheckswillbe madeeach tourofthemudsystem.The mud levelwillbe
checkedvisually.

PEIL
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c. Nochromateadditiveswillbe used inthemudsystemonFederaland/orIndianlandswithout
priorBLMapprovaltoensureadequateprotectionoffreshwateraquifers.

d. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitlell\inanamountequaltoorgreaterthan
10,000 pounds willbe used, produced, stored,transported,or disposed of annuallyin
associationwiththedrillingofthiswell. Furthermore,no extremelyhazardoussubstances,
as definedin 40 CFR355, in thresholdplanningquantities,willbe used, produced,stored,
transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

e. The use ofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformto43 CFR3610.2-3.

6. EVALUATIONPROGRAM

Theanticipatedtypeand amountoftesting,loggingand coringareas follows:

a. Nodrillstemtestsareanticipated,however,ifDST'sarerun,thefollowingrequirementswill
be adheredto:

Initialopeningof drillstem test toolsshallbe restrictedto daylighthours unless specific
approvaltostartduringotherhoursisobtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.However,DST's
maybe allowedtocontinueat nightifthetestwas initiatedduringdaylighthoursandtherate
offlowis stabilizedand ifadequatelightingis available(i.e.lightingwhichis adequatefor
visibilityandvapor-proofforsafeoperations).Packerscanbe released,buttrippingshallnot
beginbeforedaylight,unlesspriorapprovalis obtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.Closed
chamberDSTsmaybe accomplisheddayornight.

ADSTthatflowstothesurfacewithevidenceofhydrocarbonsshallbe eitherreversedout
ofthetestingstringundercontrolledsurfaceconditions.This wouldinvolveprovidedsome
meansforreversecirculation.

Separationequipmentrequiredfortheanticipatedrecoveryshallbe properlyinstalledbefore
a teststarts.

Allengineswithin100feetofthewellborethatarerequiredto"run"duringthetestshallhave
sparkarrestersorwatercooledexhausts.

b. Theloggingprogramwillconsistofa SchlumbergerPlatformExpress(orequivalent)toberun
frombase ofsurfacecasingtoT.D. p Pe
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c. Nocores are anticipated.

d. Whetherthe well is completedas a dry hole or as a producer,"WellCompletionand
RecompletionReportandLog"(Form3160-4)willbe submittednot laterthan30 days after
completionofthewelloraftercompletionofoperationsbeingperformed,inaccordancewith
43 CFR 3164. Twocopiesof all logs,core descriptions,core analyses,well-testdata,
geologicsummaries,sampledescription,andallothersurveysordataobtainedandcompiled
duringthe drilling,workover,and/orcompletionoperations,willbe filedwithform3160-4.
Samples(cutting,fluids,and/orgases0willbe submittedwhenrequestedbytheauthorized
officer(AO).

e. The anticipatedcompletionprogramwillbe as follows:Perforatemultistagefracs and
completeallproductiveMesaverdeandWasatchsands present inwellbore. Produceall
zones together.

f. Dailydrillingandcompletionprogressreportsshallbe submittedtotheBLMinVernalona
weeklybasis.

7. ABNORMALTEMPERATURESORPRESSURES

a. Theexpectedbottomholepressureis7663psi. Themaximumbottomholetemperaturewill
be 210 degrees Fahrenheit.

b. Nohydrogensulfidegas isanticipated.AbnormalPressureswillbe controlledwiththemud
weight.

8. ANTICIPATEDSTARTINGDATESANDNOTIFICATIONOFOPERATIONS

a. Drillingis plannedtocommenceuponapprovalofthisapplication.

b. Itisanticipatedthatthedrillingofthiswellwilltakeapproximately35 days.

c. The BLMin Vernal,Utahshallbe notifiedof the anticipateddate of locationconstruction
commencementand ofanticipatedspuddate.
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d. Nolocationwillbe constructedormoved,nowellwillbe plugged,andnodrillingorworkover
equipmentwillbe removedfroma welltobe placedin a suspendedstatuswithoutprior
approvaloftheAO. Ifoperationsare to be suspended, priorapprovalof the AOwillbe
obtainedand notificationgivenbeforeresumptionofoperations.

e. The spud date willbe reportedorallyto the AOwithin48 hours after spudding.Ifthe
spuddingoccursonaweekendorholiday,thereportwillbesubmittedonthefollowingregular
workday. The oralreportwillbe followedupwitha SundryNotice.

f. InaccordancewithOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,thiswellwillbe reportedonForm3160-
6 "MonthlyReportofOperations",startingwiththemonthinwhichoperationscommenceand
continueeach monthuntilthewellis physicallypluggedand abandoned.Thisreportwillbe
filedwiththeVernalBLMDistrictOffice,170 South500 East,Vernal,UT 84078.

g. ImmediateReport Spills,blowouts,fires,leaks,accidents,oranyotherunusualoccurrences
shallbe promptlyreportedin accordancewiththe requirementsof NTL-3Aor its revision.

h. Ifa replacementrigiscontemplatedforcompletionoperations,a "SundryNotice"Form3160-
5 to thateffectwillbe filed,forpriorapprovalofthe AO,and allconditionsofthisapproved
planare applicableduringalloperationsconductedwiththereplacementrig.

i. Shouldthewellbe successfullycompletedforproduction,theAOwillbe notifiedwhenthe
wellisplacedina producingstatus. Suchnotificationwillbe sentbytelegramorotherwritten
communications,not laterthan5 days followingthe date onwhichthe well is placedon
production.

j. PursuanttoOnshoreOrderNo.7, withtheapprovaloftheDistrictEngineer,producedwater
maybe temporarilydisposedofintounlinedpitsfora periodofupto90 days. Duringthe
periodso authorized,an applicationforapprovalofthepermanentdisposalmethod,along
withtherequiredwater analysisandotherinformation,mustbe submittedtotheDistrict
Engineer.

k. PursuanttoNTL-4A,lessees oroperatorsareauthorizedtovent/flaregas duringinitialwell
evaluationtests,notexceedinga periodof30 days ortheproductionof50 MMCFofgas,
whicheveroccursfirst. Anapplicationmustbe filedwiththeDistrictEngineerandapproval
received,foranyventing/flaringofgas beyondthe initial30 dayor authorizedtestperiod.
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l. Aschematicfacilitiesdiagramas requiredby43 CFR3162.7-5(b.9.d.),shallbe submittedto
the appropriateDistrictOfficewithinsixty(60) days of installationor first production,
whicheveroccursfirst.Allsitesecurityregulationsas specifiedinOnshoreOrderNo.3 shall
be adheredto. Allproductlinesenteringand leavinghydrocarbonstoragetankswillbe
effectivelysealed in accordancewith43 CFR3162.7-5(b.4.).

m. A first productionconferencewillbe scheduledwithin15 days afterreceiptof the first
productionnotice.

n. Nowellabandonmentoperationswillbe commencedwithoutthepriorapprovaloftheAO.
Inthecase ofnewlydrilleddryholesorfailures,and inemergencysituations,oralapproval
willbe obtainedfromtheSO. A"SubsequentReportofAbandonment"Form3160-5,willbe
filedwiththeAOwithin30daysfollowingcompletionofthewellforabandonment.Thisreport
willindicate where plugswere placedand the currentstatus of surface restoration. Final
abandonmentwillnot be approveduntilthe surface reclamationworkrequiredby the
approvedAPDorapprovedabandonmentnoticehas been completedtothesatisfactionof
theAOor his representative,or theappropriateSurfaceManagingAgency.

o. PursuanttoOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1, lessees andoperatorshave theresponsibility
to see that theirexploration,development,production,and constructionoperationsare
conductedina mannerwhichconformswithapplicableFederallawsandregulationsandwith
State and local laws and regulationsto the extent thatsuch State and local laws are
applicabletooperationsonFederalorindianlands.

BureauofLandManagement
170South500 East
Vernal,Utah84078

Phone:435/781-4400 Fax:435/781-4410
AfterHours:

KirkFleetwood PetroleumEngineer 435/828-7875
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NENWSection25,T9S- R18E SURFACEUSEPLAN
UintahCounty,Utah Page i

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1
NOTIFICATIONREQUIREMENTS

LocationConstruction- forty-eight(48) hourspriortoconstructionof locationandaccess roads.

LocationCompletion- priorto movingon thedrillingrig.

SpudNotice - at leasttwenty-four(24) hourspriortospuddingthewell.

CasingStringand - twenty-four(24)hourspriorto runningcasingand
Cementing cementingallcasingstrings.

BOPandRelated - twenty-four(24) hourspriorto initiatingpressuretests.
EquipmentTests

FirstProduction- withinfive(5)businessdays afternewwellbeginsor
Notice productionresumesafterwellhas been offproductionformorethan

ninety(90)days.

The onsiteinspectionforthesubjectwellsitewas conductedonWednesday,May4, 2005 at
approximately9:40a.m. Weatherconditionswerewarm,clearandsunny.Inattendanceat theonsite
inspectionwere thefollowingindividuals:

Stan Olmstead NaturalResourceSpecialistBureauofLandManagement
CarlWright BureauofLandManagement
AmyTorres WildlifeBiologist BureauofLandManagement
LisaSmith PermittingAgent PermitcoInc.
Venessa Langmacher PermittingAgent PermitcoInc.
HalMarshall Surveyor UintahEngineeringand LandSurveying

1. EXISTINGROADS

a. The proposedwellsiteis locatedapproximately23.8 milessoutheastof Myton,Utah.
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b. Directionstothe locationfromMyton,Utahareas follows:

ProceedsouthwesterlyonHighway40 for1.5miles.Turnleftandproceedsoutheasterly
forapproximately11 milestotheCastlePeak Mine.Turnleftand proceedeast for
approximately6.7 milesonthe8 mileflatroad. Stayrightandproceedsoutheasterly
approximately4.6 miles.Turnlefton theproposedaccess and proceednortherly
approximately200' untilreachingtheproposedlocation.

c. Forlocationofaccessroadswithina 2-Mileradius,see MapsA&B.

d. Improvementtoexistingmainroadswillnotbe required.

e. Allexistingroadswillbe maintainedandkeptingoodrepairduringalldrillingand
completionoperationsassociatedwiththiswell.

f. Existingroadsandnewlyconstructedroadson surfaceunderthejurisdictionofany
SurfaceManagingAgencyshallbe maintainedinaccordancewiththestandardsofthe
SMA.

2. PLANNEDACCESSROADS

a. Approximately200feet ofnewconstructionwillbe necessary. The remainderofthe
accessroadis maintainedbytheCountyoris anexistingoilfieldroad.

b. The maximumgradeofthenewconstructionwillbe approximately3%.

c. Noturnoutsareplanned.

d. Nolowwatercrossingsorculvertswillbe necessary.

e. The last200feet ofnewaccess roadwas centerlineflaggedat thetimeofstaking.

f. The use ofsurfacingmaterialis notanticipated,howeveritmaybe necessarydepending
onweatherconditions.

g. Nocattleguardswillbe necessary.
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h. Surfacedisturbanceand vehiculartravelwillbe limitedtotheapprovedlocationand
approvedaccessroute.Anyadditionalareaneededwillbe approvedinadvance.

i. Accessroadsandsurfacedisturbingactivitieswillconformtostandardsoutlinedinthe
BureauofLandManagementandForestServicepublication:SurfaceOperatinq
StandardsforOiland GasExplorationandDevelopment,(1989).

j. The roadwillbe constructedlupgradedtomeetthestandardsoftheanticipatedtrafficflow
and allweatherroadrequirements.Construction/upgradingshallincludeditching,
draining,graveling,crowingandcappingthe roadbedas necessarytoprovidea well
constructedsafe road. Priortoupgrading,the roadshallbe clearedofanysnowcover
and allowedtodrycompletely.Travelingoffthe30footright-of-waywillnotbe allowed.
Roaddrainagecrossingsshallbe ofthetypicaldrycreekdrainagecrossingtype.
Crossingsshallbe designedso theywillnotcause siltationor accumulationofdebrisin
thedrainagecrossingnorshallthedrainagesbe blockedbytheroadbed. Erosionof
drainageditchesby runoffwatershallbe preventedbydivertingwateroffat frequent
intervalsbymeansofcutouts.Upgradingshallnotbe allowedduringmuddyconditions.
Shouldmudholesdevelop,theyshallbe filledinanddetoursaroundthemavoided.

k. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitleIllinanamountequaltoorgreater
than10,000 poundswillbe used,produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofannually
inassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell. Furthermore,noextremelyhazardous
substances,as definedin40 CFR355,inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used,
produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

3. LOCATIONOFEXISTINGWELLSWITHINA1-MILERADIUSOFTHEPROPOSEDLOCATION.
(SeeMap"C")

a. Water wells- none

b. Injectionwells- none

c. Producingwells- three

d. Drillingwells- none

e. Shut-inwells- none
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f. Temporarilyabandonedwells- none

g. Disposalwells-none

h. Abandonedwells- four

4. LOCATIONOFTANKBATTERIESANDPRODUCTIONFACILITIES.

a. Allpermanentstructures(onsiteforsixmonthsor longer)constructedor installed
(includingoilwellpumpjacks)willbe paintedCarlsbadCanyon.Allfacilitieswillbe
paintedwithinsixmonthsof installation. Facilitiesrequiredtocomplywiththe
OccupationalSafetyand Health Act(OSHA)willbe excluded.

b. Ifstoragefacilities/tankbatteriesare constructedonthislease, thefacility/batteryor the
wellpadshallsurroundedbya containmentdikeofsufficientcapacitytocontainat a
minimum,theentirecontentsofthe largest tankwithinthefacility/battery,unlessmore
stringentprotectiverequirementsaredeemed necessarybytheauthorizedofficer.

c. Aproductionfacilitylayoutis attached.

d. Allloadinglineswillbe placedinsidethebermsurroundingthetankbattery.

e. Gasmeterrunsforeach wellwillbe locatedwithin500feet ofthewellhead.The gas flow
linewillbe buriedoranchoreddownfromthewellheadtothemeterand500feet
downstreamofthemeterrunoranyproductionfacilities.Meterrunswillbe housed
and/orfenced.

f. Theoiland gas measurementfacilitieswillbe installedon thewelllocation. The oiland
gasmeterswillbe calibratedinplacepriortoanydeliveries.Tests formeteraccuracywill
be conductedmonthlyforthefirstthreemonthsonnewmeterinstallationsandat least
quarterlythereafter.The AOwillbe providedwitha date andtimefortheinitialmeter
calibrationandallfuturemeterprovingschedules. Acopyofthemetercalibrationreports
willbe submittedtotheVernalFieldOffice.Allmetermeasurementfacilitieswillconform
withOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.4 forliquidhydrocarbonsandOnshoreOilandGas
OrderNo.5 fornaturalgas measurement.
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g. Ifat any timethefacilitieslocated on publicland and authorizedbythetermsofthe lease
areno longerincluded in the lease (duetoa contractionintheunitorotherlease orunit
boundarychange),BLMwillprocessa changeinauthorizationtotheappropriatestatute.
Theauthorizationwillbe subjecttoappropriaterentalorotherfinancialobligationas
determinedbytheauthorizedofficer.

h. Anynecessarypitswillbe properlyfencedtopreventanywildlifeentry.

i. Allsitesecurityguidelinesidentifiedin43 CFR3162.7regulationswillbe adheredto.

j. Alloff-leasestorage,off-leasemeasurement,orcomminglingon-leaseoroff-leasewill
have priorwrittenapprovalfromthe DistrictManager.

k. Allaccess roadswillbe maintainedas necessarytopreventerosionand accommodate
year-roundtraffic.

I. The roadwillbe maintainedina safe useablecondition.

m. Produced water willbe storedin a 300 bbl heated, insulated tank,thenhauled to a
commercialdisposalsitesuchas DisposalInc.,or BrennanBottom.

n. Pipelineswillfollowtherouteshownon MapD. See Pipelinedetailattached.

5. LOCATIONANDTYPEOFWATERSUPPLY

a. The proposedwatersourcewillbe theNebeckerWaterServiceat theNebeckerWater
StationinMyton,permit#43-1723,orproducedfieldwater.

b. Waterwillbe hauledbyNebeckerWaterService tothelocationovertheaccess roads
shownonMapsAandB.

c. Nowaterwellwillbe drilledon thislease.

6. SOURCEOFCONSTRUCTIONMATERIAL

a. Surfaceandsubsoilmaterialsinthe immediateareawillbe utilized.
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b. Anygravelused willbe obtainedfroma commercialsource.

c. Theuse ofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformwith43 CFR3610.2.3.
Constructionmaterialwillnotbe locatedon lease.

d. Noconstructionmaterialswillbe removedfromFederalland.

7. METHODSOFHANDLINGWASTEDISPOSAL

a. The reservepitwillbe constructedsoas nottoleak,break,orallowdischarge,

b. AttherequestoftheBLM,thereservepitwillbe linedwitha 12 milliner. Iffracturedrock
is encountered,thepitwillbe firstlinedwithsufficientbedding(eitherstrawordirt)to
coveranyrocks.The linerwilloverlapthepitwallsandbe coveredwithdirtand/orrocks
toholditinplace. Notrash,scrappipe,etc.,thatcouldpuncturethelinerwillbe disposed
ofinthepit. Morestringentprotectiverequirementsmaybe deemed necessarybythe
A.O.

c. Burningwillnotbe allowed.Alltrashwillbe containedina trashcageand itscontents
removedattheend ofdrillingoperationsand hauledtoan approveddisposal sight.

d. Afterfirstproduction,producedwastewaterwillbe confinedtoa unlinedpitorstorage
tankfora periodnottoexceed ninety(90)days. Duringthe90-dayperiod,inaccordance
withOnshoreOrderNo.7, an applicationforapprovalofa permanentdisposalmethod
and location,alongwiththerequiredwateranalysis,willbe submittedfortheAO's
approval.Failuretofilean applicationwithinthetimeallowedwillbe consideredan
incidentofnoncompliance.

e. Drillcuttingsaretobe containedandburiedinthereservepit.

f. Anysaltsand/orchemicalswhicharean integralpartofthedrillingsystemwillbe
disposedof inthesame manneras thedrillingfluid.

g. Achemicalporta-toiletwillbe furnishedwiththedrillingrig.

h. The producedfluidswillbe producedintoa testtankuntilsuch timeas constructionof
productionfacilitiesiscompleted.Anyspillsofoil,gas saltwaterorotherproducedfluids
willbe cleanedupand removed. ¢ PM
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8. ANClLLARYFACILITIES

Thereareno airstrips,camps,or otherfacilitiesplannedduringthedrillingoftheproposedwell.

9. WELLSITELAYOUT

a. Theoperatororhis/hercontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficeat 435/781-4400forty-
eight(48) hourspriortoconstructionactivities.

b. The reservepitwillbe locatedonthewestsideofthe location.

c. Theflarepitwillbe locatedonthenorthsideofthe reservepit, a minimumof100 feet
fromthewellhead and20 feetfromthereservepitfence.

d. Thestockpiledtopsoil(firstsixinches) willbe storedaroundtheperimeterofthewellpad,
as shownontheattacheddiagram.Topsoilalongtheaccessroutewillbe windrowedon
theuphillside. Pittopsoilwillbe storednear thepit.

e. Accesstothewellpadwillbe fromthesouthas shownonthePit&Pad Layout.

f. See LocationLayoutfororientationofrig,cross sectionofdrillpad andcutsandfills.

g. The locationofmudtanks;reservepit,trashcage; piperacks;livingfacilitiesand soil
stockpileswillbe shownon theLocationLayout.

h. Allpitswillbe fencedaccordingtothefollowingminimumstandards:

1. 39 inch netwireshallbe used withat least one strandor barbed wire on topof
thenet wire(barbedwireis notnecessaryifpipeorsometypeofreinforcement
rodis attachedtothetopoftheentirefence).

2. The netwireshallbe no morethan2-inchesabovetheground. The barbedwire
shallbe 3-inchesabovethenetwire. Totalheightofthefenceshallbe at least
42-inches.
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3. Cornerpostsshallbe cementedand/orbraced in sucha mannertokeep the
fencetightat alltimes.

4. Standardsteel,wood,or pipepostsshallbe used betweenthecornerbraces.
Maximumdistancebetweenany twopostsshallbe no greaterthan16 feet.

5. Allwireshallbe stretched,byusinga stretchingdevice,beforeitis attachedto
thecornerposts.

i. The reservepitfencingwillbe onthreesidesduringdrillingoperationsandon thefourth
sidewhentherigmovesoffthelocation.Pitswillbe fencedandmaintaineduntilcleanup.

10. PLANSFORRESTORATIONOFSURFACE

ProducinqLocation

a. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,the locationand surroundingarea willbe clearedofall
unused tubing,equipment,debris, materials,trashand junknot requiredforproduction.

b. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,anyhydrocarbonsonthepitshallbe removedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.7-1.

c. Ifa plasticnylonreinforcedlineris used itshallbe tornandperforatedbeforebackfillingof
thereservepit.

d. The reservepitandthatportionofthe locationnotneeded forproductionfacilitiesor
operationswillbe recontouredtotheapproximatenaturalcontours.The reservepitwillbe
reclaimedwithin120days fromthedate ofwellcompletion.Beforeanydirtworktakes
place,thereservepitmusthaveallfluidsandhydrocarbonsremovedandallcans,
barrels,pipe,etc.,willbe removed.

e. Reclamation ofunuseddisturbedareas onthewellpad/access roadno longerneeded for
operations,such as cutslopes,andfillareas willbe accomplishedbygrading,leveling
andseedingas recommendedbytheAuthorizedOfficer.Aseed mixturewillbe specified
bytheBureauof LandManagement in theirConditionsofApprovalforthesubject
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Seedingwillbe performedimmediatelyafterthe locationhas been reclaimedandthepit
has been backfilled,regardlessofthetimeofyear. Seed willbe broadcastand walkedin
witha dozer.

f. Thetopsoilstockpilewillbe seeded as soon as the locationhas been constructedwiththe
samerecommendedseed mix.Theseedwillbe walkedinwitha cat.

g. Thefollowingseedmixturehas been recommendedbytheBLM.

Species #/s per Acre

Shadscale 3

Fourwing 3

GlobeMallow 3

IndianRicegrass 3

TOTAL 12

DrvHole

h. Atsuchtimeas thewellis pluggedandabandoned,theoperatorshallsubmita
subsequentreportofabandonmentand BLMwillattachtheappropriatesurface
rehabilitationconditionsofapproval.

11. SURFACEOWNERSHIP

AccessRoads - AlloftheaccessroadsaremaintainedbytheCountyRoadDepartmentor the
BureauofLandManagement.

Wellpad - Thewellpadis locatedon landsmanagedbytheBLM.
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12. OTHERINFORMATION

a. AClassIllarcheologicalsurveyhas been conductedbyGrandRiverInstitute.Acopyof
thisreportis attached.

b. Theoperatoris responsibleforinformingallpersonsintheareas whoareassociatedwith
thisprojectthattheywillbe subjecttoprosecutionforknowinglydisturbinghistoricor
archaeologicalsites, or forcollectingartifacts. Ifhistoricorarchaeologicalmaterialsare
uncoveredduringconstruction,theoperatoris to immediatelystopworkthatmightfurther
disturbsuch materials,andcontacttheauthorizedofficer(AO).Withinfiveworkingdays
theAOwillinformtheoperatoras to:

-whether thematerialsappeareligiblefortheNationalRegisterofHistoricPlaces;

-the mitigationmeasurestheoperatorwilllikelyhave to undertakebeforethesite canbe
used (assuminginsitupreservationis notnecessary);and

-a timeframefortheAOtocompleteandexpeditedreviewunder36 CFR800.11to
confirm,throughtheState HistoricPreservation Officer,thatthefindingsoftheAOare
correctandthatmitigationisappropriate.Iftheoperatorwishes,at anytime,torelocate
activitiestoavoidtheexpenseofmitigationand/orthedelaysassociatedwiththis
process,theAOwillassumeresponsibilityforwhateverrecordationandstabilizationof
theexposedmaterialsmaybe required.Otherwise,theoperatorwillbe responsiblefor
mitigationcosts. TheAOwillprovidetechnicalandproceduralguidelinesfortheconduct
ofmitigation.UponverificationfromtheAOthatrequiredmitigationhas been completed,
theoperatorwillthenbe allowedto resumeconstruction.

c. Theoperatorwillcontrolnoxiousweedsalongrights-of-wayforroads,pipelines,wellsites,
orotherapplicablefacilities.Alistofnoxiousweeds maybe obtainedfromtheBLM,or
theappropriateCountyExtensionOffice.On BLMadministeredlanditis requiredthata
PesticideUseProposalshallbe submitted,andgivenapproval,priortotheapplicationof
herbicidesorotherpesticidesor possiblehazardouschemicals.

d. Drillingrigsand/orequipmentused duringdrillingoperationsonthiswellsitewillnotbe
stackedor storedonFederalLandsaftertheconclusionofdrillingoperationsorat any
othertimewithoutBLMauthorization.However,ifBLMauthorizationis obtained,it is only
a temporarymeasure.
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e. Alllease and/orunitoperationswillbe conductedin such a mannerthatfullcomplianceis
madewithallapplicablelaws,regulations,OnshoreOilandGas Orders,theapproved
planofoperations,andanyapplicableNoticetoLessees. Theoperatoris fully
responsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe
furnishedthefieldrepresentativeto insurecompliance.

f. AcompletecopyoftheapprovedAPDshallbe onlocationduringconstructionofthe
locationanddrillingactivities.

g. There willbe nodeviationfromtheproposeddrillingand/orworkoverprogramwithout
priorapprovalfromtheAO.Safe drillingand operatingpracticesmustbe observed. All
wells,whetherdrilling,producing,suspendedorabandonedwillbe identifiedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.

h. "SundryNoticeand ReportonWells"(Form3160-5)willbe filedforapprovalforall
changesofplansand otheroperationsinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.3-2.

i. Thispermitwillbe validfora periodofoneyear fromthedate ofapproval.Anextension
periodmaybe granted,ifrequested,priortotheexpirationoftheoriginalapprovalperiod.
Afterpermittermination,a newapplicationwillbe filedforapprovalforanyfuture
operations.

j. Theoperatoror hiscontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficesat435/781-440048 hours
priortoconstructionactivities.

k. The BLMOfficeshallbe notifieduponsitecompletionpriortomovingon thedrillingrig.

13. LESSEE'SOROPERATOR'SREPRESENTATIVEANDCERTIFICATION

Permit Matters Drillinq&CompletionMatters

PERMITCOINC. Gasco Production Company
14421 CountyRoad10 14 InvernessDriveEast,SuiteH-236
Ft.Lupton,CO80621 Englewood,CO80112
303/857-9999(0) John Longwell
303/857-0577(F) 303/483-0044(0)
LisaSmith 303/483-0011(F)

ShawnElworthy- FieldSuperintendent S
Roosevelt,UT
435-823-4272
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CERTIFICATION

IherebycertifythatI,or personsundermydirectsupervision,have inspectedtheproposeddrill
siteandaccess route;thatIam familiarwiththeconditionswhichpresentlyexist;thatthe
statementsmade inthisplanare,tothebest ofmyknowledge,trueandcorrect;and,thatthe
workassociatedwiththeoperationsproposedhereinwillbe performedbyGasco Production
Companyandits contractorsand subcontractorsin conformitywiththeplanandthetermsand
conditionsunderwhichit is approved.

Thisstatementis subjecttotheprovisionsof 18.U.S.C.1001 forthefilingofa falsestatement.

May17,2005 g dû QÑ0
Date: Venessa Langmacher RMITCOINC.

AuthorizedAgentfor:
GascoProductionCompany
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PIPELINE INFORMATION
Sheep Wash Federal #21-25-9-18

1. The type of pipeline is a single well flow line.

2. The outside diameter (O.D.) of all will be 8 inches or smaller.

3. The anticipated production throughthe line is approximately 2000 MCF per day.

4. The anticipated maximum test pressure is 1000 psi.

5. The anticipated operating pressure is 150 psi.

6. The type of pipe is steel.

7. The method of coupling is welded.

8. There are no other pipelines to be associated in same right of way.

9. There are no other objects to be associated in the same right of way.

10. The total length of pipeline is approximately 4900 feet - see Map D.

11. The line willbe laid on the surface, adjacent to the road as shown on Map D.

12. The pipeline willonly be buried under existing road crossings, prior to reaching the
tie-inpoint. Backfilling willonly be necessary where the pipeline crosses under the
road.

13. The construction width needed for totalsurface disturbing activities is 30 feet.

14. The estimated totalacreage involving all surface disturbing activities is 3.37 acres.

15. Any surface disturbance created as a result of the pipeline construction will be
reclaimed utilizing the reclamation procedures and seed mixture specified by the
Bureau of Land
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FEDERALSTIPULATIONSANDTIMINGRESTRICTIONS

Thereare no FederalStipulationsat thistime.
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+ Grand River Institute *
P.O. Box 3543 + Grand Junction, CO 81502 + 970/245-7868 FAX 970/245-6317

April 30, 2005

Gasco, Inc.
14 Inverness Drive East
Suite H-236
Englewood, CO 80112

Attn: Mike Decker

Re: GRI Project No. 2515 - Class III cultural resources inventory of eight proposed well

locations (Fed. #21-30-9-19, Fed. #23-19-9-19, Fed. #41-30-9-19, Fed. #43-19-9-19,

Sheep Wash Fed. #21-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #41-

25-9-18, and Sheep Wash Fed. #43-25-9-18) and 1.85 miles of linear routes in the Sheep

Wash area of Uintah County, Utah [UO5-GB-0236b]

GRI Project No. 2516 -- Class III cultural resources inventory for the proposed Wilkin

Ridge Fed. #21-12-11-17 and related access/ pipeline route (9050 feet) in Uintah

County, Utah, [UO5-GB-0079bs]

GRI Project No. 2517 - Class III cultural resources inventory for the proposed Gate

Canyon State #34-21-11-15 well location and its related new access and pipeline routes

(5310 feet) in Duchesne County, Utah [UO5-GB-0235s]

Dear Mike:

Enclosed are two copies of our final reports for the above cited projects. Copies have

been distributed as indicated below. Also enclosed is our invoice. Please call me if you

have any questions or comments.

Sincerely,

Carl E. Conner
Director

Enc.

Distribution:
4 (2, 2516 and 2, 2517) - Kenny Wintch, Utah State Land Trust

4 (2, 2515 and 2, 2516) - Blaine Phillips, BLM Vernal Field Office
1 ea) - Lisa Smith, Permitco

Archaeology + Paleontology & History * Environmental

+ Grand River Institute *
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Fed. #43-25-9-18) and 1.85 miles of linear routes in the Sheep Wash area of Uintah County
2. Report Date: 4/29/2005 3. Date(s) of Survey: 22ndand 23" of April 2005

4. Development Company: Gasco Production Company

5. Responsible Institution: BLM Vernal Office

6. Responsible Individuals Principal Investigator: Field Supervisor: Carl E. Conner

Report Author(s): Carl E. Conner

7. BLM Field Office: Vernal Field Office

8. County(ies): Uintah

9. Fieldwork Location: T.9S., R.18E., Sec. 25; and, T.9S., R.19E., See. 19 and 30; SLBM

10. Record Search:

Location of Records Searched for BLM: BLM Vernal/UDSH Date: 4/21/05 and 4/6/2005

11. Description of Proposed Project: Eight proposed weH locations and a 1.85 miles of access

roads/ pipeline routes

12. Description of Examination Procedures: A Class III, 100% pedestrian, cultural resources
survey of the proposed weH Iocations was made by walking a series of concentric circles
around the flagged centers to diameters of 750 feet. The related access and pipeline routes

not included within the 10-acre study plots were surveyed by walking four paraHel
transects spaced at 15m intervals and centered on the flagged lines to cover corridors 200
feet wide (60m). A total of about 120 acres was intensively surveyed. The basic approach

to the data coHection was the continuous mapping of observed artifacts and features by
recording UTM coordinates (NAD 83 Datum) using a Trimble Geo XT. Site maps were
created using differentially corrected data together with ArcMap. Photographs were taken
at each site and include general views and specific artifacts or features. Field notes and
photo negatives are filed at Grand River Institute, while the photographs are submitted to
the BLM and UDSH. No artifacts were
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13. Area Surveyed: BLM OTHER FED STATE PRI.

Linear Miles Intensive: 1.85

Recon/Intuitive:

Acreage Intensive: 75

Recon/Intuitive:

14. Sites Recorded:

Smithsonian Site Numbers # BLM OTHER FED STATE PRI.

Revisits NR Eligible 0

(no IMACS form) Not Eligible 0

Revisits NR Eligible 1 42UN2931

updated IMACS) Not Eligible 1 42UNI180

New NR Eligible 3 42UN4790
42UN4791

Recordings 42UN4792

Not Eligible 0

Total Number of 5

Archaeological Sites

Historic Structures 0

(USHS Form)

Total National Register 4 42UN2931
42UN4790

Eligible Sites 42UN4791
42UN4792

15. Description of Findings: (see attached report) As a result, two isolated finds and three
sites (42UN4790, 42UN4791 and 42UN4792) were recorded. Two previously recorded sites

(42UN1180 and 42UN2931) were revisited to ascertain their relationship to the proposed

well locations.
16. Collection Yes

17. Conclusion/Recommendations: The newly recorded sites and 42UN2931 were field

evaluated as significant and eligible for listing on the National Register of Historic Places.

Site 42UN1180 was previously evaluated as non-significant and no change was made to that

evaluation. Site 42UN4790 is presently within the proposed impact area for the Fed. #41-

30-9-19 weH location. It should be avoided. A 5-acre addition was inventoried west of the
welPs original 10-acre block survey area to allow for the well center's movement in that
direction. The remaining sites wiR be avoided, so no further work is recommended.
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Abstract

Grand River Institute conducted a Class III cultural resources inventory for Gasco
Production Company of eight proposed well locations (Fed. #21-30-9-19, Fed. #23-19-9-19,
Fed. #41-30-9-19, Fed. #43-19-9-19, Sheep Wash Fed. #21-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #23-

25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #41-25-9-18, and Sheep Wash Fed. #43-25-9-18) and 1,85 miles
(9740 feet) of linear routes (roads and/or pipelines) in Uintah County, Utah, under BLM
Antiquities Permit No. 05UT-54939 and Utah Division of State History (UDSH) Project
Authorization No. UO5-GB-0236b, This work was done to meet requirements of Federal
and State laws that protect cultural resources.

Files searches conducted through the BLM Vernal District Office (BLM) and

through the UDSH indicated two sites (42UN1180 and 42DN2931) were previously
recorded in the project areas. Field work was performed on the 22ndand 23rdOf April 2005.
A total of about 120 acres (BLM) was inspected. As a result, two isolated fmds and three
sites (42UN4790, 42UN4791 and 42UN4792) were recorded. The two previously recorded

sites (42UN1180 and 42UN2931) were revisited to ascertain their relationship to the
proposed well locations. The newly recorded sites and 42UN2931 were field evaluated as
significant and eligible for listing on the National Register of Historic Places. Site
42UN1180 was previously evaluated as non-significant and no change was made to that
evaluation.

Site 42UN4790 is presently within the proposed impact area for the Fed. #41-30-9-

19 well location. It should be avoided. A 5-acre addition was inventoried west of the welPs
original 10-acre block survey area to allow for the well center's movement in that direction.
The remaining sites will be avoided, so no furtber work is recommended.
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Introduction

At the request of Gasco Production Company and the Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office (BLM), Grand River Institute conducted a Class III cultural resources

inventory for Gasco Production Company of eight proposed well locations (Fed. #21-30-9-

19, Fed. #23-19-9-19, Fed. #41-30-9-19, Fed. #43-19-9-19, Sheep Wash Fed. #21-25-9-18,

Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18, Sheep Wash Fed. #41-25-9-18, and Sheep Wash Fed. #43-

25-9-18) and 1.85 miles (9740 feet) of linear routes (roads and/or pipelines) under BLM
Antiquities Permit No. 05UT-54939 and Utah Division of State History (UDSH) Project
Authorization No. UO5-GB-0236b. The file searches, survey and report were completed by
Carl E. Conner (Principal Investigator) and Barbara J. Davenport of GRI. Field work was

performed on the 22ndand 23" of April 2005. A total of 120 acres (BLM) was inspected.

The survey was done to meet requirements of the Federal Land Policy and
Management Act of 1976, the National Historic Preservation Act as amended in 1992, and

the National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) of 1969. These laws are concerned with the
identification, evaluation, and protection of fragile, non-renewable evidences of human
activity, occupation and endeavor reflected in districts, sites, structures, artifacts, objects,
ruins, works of art, architecture, and natural features that were of importance in human
events. Such resources tend to be localized and highly sensitive to disturbance.

Location of Project Aren

The study area's discrete units lie southwest of Vernal, Utah, in the Sheep Wash area
of Uintah County. The 10-acre blocks surveyed for the proposed new well locations, and the
200-foot-wide corridors inventoried for the proposed new access roads and/or pipeline
routes are in T. 9 S., R. 18 E., Section 25; and, T. 9 S., R. 19 E., Sections 19 and 30; SLBM.

Environment

The project areas are within the major geologic subdivision of the Colorado Plateau
known as the Uinta Basin Section. In Utah, this section extends from the Uinta Mountains
on the north to the Book Cliffs on the south. It is a broad downwarp into which Quaternary-
and Tertiary-age deposits were made from the surrounding mountains which include
Holocene and Pleistocene pediment deposits, and Eocene-age fluvial and lacustrine
sedimentary rocks (Rigby 1976:xi). Physiographically, the basin includes the Uinta basin in
the north portion and the Book Cliffs/Roan Plateau in the south portion. The lower Uinta
Formation is the bedrock of the study area. Holocene and Pleistocene-age alluvium and
colluvium occur as a veneer over the Uinta. It consists of channel and flood-plain stream
deposits. Soils encountered were rocky, shaley, silty, and sandy loams, which are in general
formed in residuum from the underlying formation. However, dunes are common in this
region as well.
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Figure 1. Project location map for the Class III cultural resource inventory for eight proposed

Sheep Wash area Federal well locations and related new access/pipeline routes (1.85 miles)

in Uintah County for Gasco Production Company. Areas surveyed for cultural resources are
highlighted. [GRI Project No. #2515, 4/29/05]
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Elevations in the project area range from 4780-to-4950 feet. The terrain is
characterized as bench land that is cut by dendritic washes. Vegetation is a shadscale desert
community throughout most of the area. Notably, Indian Ricegrass occurs on the stabilized
dunes that border many of the small buttes in the area, and may have been a significant
source of food for the native inhabitants. Regional faunal inhabitants include deer, antelope,
elk, black bear, coyote, mountain lion, cottontails, jack rabbits, and various raptores.

A cool, mid-latitude steppe climate prevails. Annual precipitation of this elevation
range is between 7 and 10 inches. Temperatures range from 100°F in the summer to -40°F

in January. Paleoeuvironmental data are scant, but it is generally agreed that gross climatic
conditions have remained fairly constant over the last 12,000 years. However, changes in
effective moisture, and cooling-warming trends probably affected the prehistoric occupation
of the region.

Files Search

Files searches were conducted through BLM and UDSH. Previous projects in the
areas near the inventory blocks and linear routes are numerous and generally relate to oil and
gas development. Those that are adjacent to the project areas are discussed below.

Numerous projects have been completed in the Sections indicated in the Location of
Project portion of the report. Significant to this report are those projects shown on Figure 1,
including: USO-AF-0516b, U81-NH-429, UOO-AY-319bs, U00-AF-206b, UOO-AF-576b,
and UO1-MQ-694b.Of those, UOO-AY-319bs and U00-AF-576bs cover the area for the
proposed pipeline route to the Sheep Wash Fed. #23-25-9-18. Also the existing road to the
Sheep Wash Fed. #43-25-9-18 has been inventoried by two projects: UOO-AF-206b and
U00-AF-576bs. Project U01-MQ-694bincludes two 40-acre blocks that overlay two
portions of our project area: the proposed Fed. #23-19-9-19 and a nearby road/pipeline
segment. With the 40-acre block that includes the proposed Fed. #23-19-9-19, site
42UN2931 was previously recorded. Site 42UN1180 was recorded as part of project #U81-
NH-429, and occurs along the north border of the 10-acre study area for the Sheep Wash
Fed. #41-25-9-18. Both the previously recorded sites were relocated to determine their
relationship to the proposed actions.

Regional archaeological studies suggest neatly cortinuous human occupation of
northeastern Utah for the past 12,000 years. Evidence of the Paleoindian Tradition, the
Archaic Tradition, Fremont Culture, and Protohistoric/Historie Utes has been found.
Historic records suggest occupation or use by EuroAmerican trappers, settlers, miners, and
ranchers as well. Overviews of the prehistory and history of the region are provided in the
Utah BLM Cultural Resource Series No. 11, Archaeological Inventory in the Seep Ridge
Cultural Study Tract, Uintah County, Northeastern Utah with a Regional Predictive Model
for Site Locations (Chandler and Larralde 1980), and in Cultural Resources Existing Data
Inventory Vernal District, Utah (Jones and Mackay 1980).
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Study Objectives

The purpose of the study was to identify and record all cultural resources within the
areas of potential impact and to assess their significance and eligibility to the National
Register of Historic Places (NRHP). The statements of significance included in this report
are field assessments made in support of recommendations to the BLM and State Historic
Preservation Officer (SHPO), and the final determination of site significance is made by the
BLM in consultation with the SHPO.

Paleontological resources were also considered in the inspection. However, a final
evaluation of those resources must be provided by a paleontologist permitted by Utah.

Field Methods

A Class III, 100% pedestrian, cultural resources survey of the proposed well
locations was made by walking a series of concentric circles around the flagged centers to
diameters of 750 feet. The related access and pipeline routes not included within the 10-acre
study plots or the previous survey areas were surveyed by walking four parallel transects
spaced at 15m intervals and centered on the flagged lines to cover corridors 200 feet wide.

Cultural resources were sought as surface exposures and were characterized as sites
or isolated finds. Sites were defined by the presence of six or more artifàcts and/or
significant feature(s) indicative of patterned human activity. Isolated finds were defined by
the presence of 1 to 5 artifacts apparently of surficial nature. Cultural resources encountered
were to be recorded to standards set by the Utah Division of State History (UDSH).

The basic approach to the data collection was the continuous mapping of observed
artifacts and features by recording UTM coordinates (NAD 83 Datum) using a Trimble Geo
XT. Site maps were created using corrected data and ARCMAP. Photographs were to be
taken at each site and to include general views and specific artifacts or features. Field notes
and photo negatives are filed at Grand River Institute, while the photographs are submitted
to the BLM and UDSH. No artifacts were collected.

Study Findings

As expected, cultural resources were encountered during the survey. Two isolated
finds and three sites (42UN4790, 42UN4791 and 42UN4792) were newly recorded. Two
previously recorded sites (42UN1180 and 42UN2931) were revisited to ascertain their
relationship to the proposed well locations. No paleontological resources were found. This
portion of the report presents a discussion of site significance evaluation, describes the sites
and provides their field evaluations. Appendix A contains the resources' location data and
the IMACS site forms.
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Site Significance

The National Historic Preservation Act of 1966 (NHPA) directs federal agencies to
ensure that federally-initiated or authorized actions do not inadvertently disturb or destroy
significant cultural resource values. Significance is a quality of cultural resource properties
that qualifies them for inclusion in the NRHP. The statements of significance included in
this report are field assessments to support recorunendations to the BLM and State Historic
Preservation Officer (SHPO). The final determination of site significance is made by the
controlling agencies in consultation with the SHPO and the Keeper of the Register.

The Code of Federal Regulations was used as a guide for the in-field site evaluations.

Titles 36 CFR 50, 36 CFR 800, and 36 CFR 64 are concerned with the concepts of
significance and (possible) historie value of cultural resources. Titles 36 CFR 65 and 36
CFR 66 provide standards for the conduct of significant and scientific data recovery
activities. Finally, Title 36 CFR 60.6 establishes the measure of significance that is critical

to the determination of a site's NRHP eligibility, which is used to assess a site's research
potential:

The quality of significance in American history, architecture, archaeology, and culture is
present in districts, sites, buildings, structures, and objects of State and local importance that
possess integrity of location, design, setting, materials, workmanship, feeling, and

association, and a) that are associated with events that have made a significant contribution

to the broad patterns of history; or b) that are associated with the lives of persons significant
in our past; or c) that embody the distinctive characteristics of a type, period, or method of
construction, or that represent the work of a master, or that possess high artistic values, or

that represent a significant and distinguishable entity whose components may lack
individual distinction; or d) that have yielded, or may be likely to yield, information
important in the prehistory or history.

Site Descriptions

Site 42UN1180 is an open lithic scatter previously recorded by Nickens and
Associates in 1981 as part of the Bonanza-Upalco Transmission Line portion of the Moon
Lake Transmission Lines Project (U81-NH-429). It was described as a thin scatter of
artifacts in a bowl-like feature and also a sandstone ridge comprising the north edge of the
bowl. A chalcedony corner-notched projectile point and a chert biface were recovered from
the site. This revisit located one projectile point tip and established GPS data for the sites
previously mapped topographic features.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
This site was previously evaluated as non-significant due to the apparent minimal

depth of cultural deposits and the lack of features. No change was made to that evaluation.
The site is presently north of the proposed impact area for the well location. No further
work is recommended.
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Site 42UN2931 is an open lithic scatter previously recorded by Montgomery
Archaeological Consultants in 2001 as part of the Phiuip's Three Wells at Wilkin Ridge and
Riverbend Project (UOl-MQ-0694b).It was described as a lithic scatter dispersed
throughout a deflated aeolian dune area, with a few artifacts occurring on the dunes to either
side. A McKean lanceolate point, an Elko Earred point, and an Elko corner-notched point
were previously found at the site. This revisit relocated the established datum and found it
to be exactly where the previous GPS data had been plotted.

Evaluation and Manaaement Recommendation
This site was previously evaluated as significant due to its potential to yield

additional important information from likely buried deposits. No change was made to that
evaluation. The site lies southeast of the proposed impact area for the well location. No
further work is recommended.

Site 42UN4790 is a prehistoric open camp located on the valley floor at the base of a
large sand dune. The sparse vegetation is desert shadscale and four-wing saltbush. The soil
on the site is hard-packed sand. The aspect is open and the elevation is 4720 feet.

The overall artifact distribution is located in an area measuring approximately 40
meters in diameter. The collection consists mainly of flakes but a few tools and one

groundstone item were also identified. The groundstone is a single cobble mano of meta-

sandstone. Two large utilized flakes and a large butchering tool were point plotted. Lithic
materials consist mainly of cherts, quartzites, and mudstones and number over 300. The
chert is Parachute Creek type, wbich often has a varnish patina. Such patination is an
indication of the relative age of the artifacts, as indicated from the study of the Pariette
Overlook Site by Hauck and Weder (1989:39-42), and suggest that these flakes may be of

Archaic Era or Paleoindian Era age. No hearth or architectural features were noted,
however, the presence of such is possible in the subsurface deposits of the sand dune south
of the surface artifacts.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
Given the likelihood of depth of cultural fill in the dunes to the south, the site is

considered significant and may contain additional important information regarding the
prehistory of the local region. The site is presently within the proposed impact area for the
well location. Avoidance is recommended.

Site 42UN4791 is a prehistoric semi-sheltered camp located at the base and on the
slope of a prominent bedrock outerop in an otherwise open, fairly level topography. The
vegetation is predominantly blackbrush in sandy, dune-like soil. Indian Ricegrass was also

noted. The site has a northeast aspect and a good view of the surrounding valley. Elevation
is 4820 feet.
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Measuring approximately 60 meters NW-SE by 30 meters NE-SW the site consists
of a Shoshonean knife base fragment, two manos, five cobbles (or fragments thereof), a
utilized flake, two flakes, and a collectors pile of 5+ flakes. A few of the cobbles have also

been utilized. The manos are all of meta-sandstone and the one at the southeast edge of the

site has a thumbhole ground in its surface. Lithic materials present are green siltstone, white

quartzite and black chalcedony ( Shoshonean knife). The small shelter portion of the site

did not yield artifactual material per se, but it is likely the shelter was occupied at times. No
hearth features were noted, however, the sandy soils appear deep and subsurface cultural
deposits are likely.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
Given the likelihood of depth of cultural fill on the north and east porions of the site,

it is considered significant and may contain additional important information regarding the
prehistory of the local region. Avoidance and preservation are recommended, and at this
time the site is presently avoided by the proposed project. Accordingly, no further work is
recommended.

Site 42UN4792 is a prehistoric sheltered camp located on the south side of a large,
prominent bedrock outcrop. Elevation averages 4820 feet and the sparse vegetation consists

of a few small blackbrush plants and native grasses. Soils are sandy and pebbly.

The site area is large, measuring 480 meters E-W by 130 meters N-S and extends
nearly the entire length of the south side of the bedrock exposure. Artifacts are distributed
along the face of the bedrock and down the fairly steep slope. Several portions of the rock
outcrop afford shelter although no thermal or architectural features were noted. Artifacts
consist of large cobbles (3), manos (2), choppers (3), a scraper, a hafted axe, a hammerstone,
large flakes (7) and a collector's pile (5 flakes). No diagnostic items were observed and this
may be due to local unauthorized collecting as evidenced by the collector's pile at the east

end of the site area. Subsurface cultural deposits are likely however.

Evaluation and Management Recommendation
Given the likelihood of depth of cultural fill on the south side of the butte with the

sandy soils, it is considered significant and may contain additional important information
regarding the prehistory of the local region. Avoidance and preservation are recommended,
and at this time the site is presently avoided by the proposed project. Accordingly, no
further work is reconunended.

Summary of Site Evaluations and Management Recommendations

The eligibility determination and consultation process is guided by Section 106 of the
NHPA (36 CFR 60, 63, and 800). Inventory to identify, evaluate, and mitigate potential
effects to cultural resources affected by an undertaking is the first steg in the Section 106
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process. BLM actions cannot be authorized until the Section 106 process is completed (36
CFR 800.3). In brief, the inventory recorded two prehistoric lithic scatters and two isolated
finds.

As a result of the inventory, two isolated finds and three sites (42UN4790,
42UN4791 and 42UN4792) were recorded. Two previously recorded sites (42UN1180 and

42UN2931) were revisited. The newly recorded sites and 42UN2931 were field evaluated as

significant and eligible for listing on the National Register of Historic Places. Site
42UN1180 was previously evaluated as non-significant and no change was made to that
evaluation.

Site 42UN4790 is presently within the proposed impact area for the Fed. #41-30-9-
19 well location. It should be avoided. A 5-acre addition was inventoried west of the well's
original10-acre block survey area to allow for the well center's movement in that direction.
The remaining sites will be avoided, so no further work is recommended.
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original10-acre block survey area to allow for the well center's movement in that direction.
The remaining sites will be avoided, so no further work is recommended.
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Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field office
170 S. 500 E.
vernal, UT 84078

Attn: Minerals

Re: All Wells
Uintah county, Utah

Gentlemen:

This letter is to inform you that PermitcO Inc. is
authorized to act as Agent and to sign documents on behalf of
(Company Name) when necessary for filing county, state and
federal permits including onshore order No. 1, Right of way
applications, etc., for the above mentioned well.

It should be understood that Permitco is acting as Agent
only in those matters stated above and is not responsible for
drilling, completion, production or compliance with regulations.

asco &½ws , &c. ÑM N O¾y (Company Name)
agrees to accept ful responéibility for opefations conducted in
order to drill, complete and produce the above-mentioned well.

Sincerely,

oþn . ngwell
o rati s
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«ASCO PRODUCTION COMPArd
TYPlCAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR

x-section SHEEP WASH FEDERAL #21-25-9-18
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APPROXIMATE YARDAGES 5% EOR COMPACT/0N
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Rernaining Location = 10,210 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)

EXCESS UNBALANCE = 1,380 Cu. Yds.
TOTAL CUT = 12,300 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)

FILL = 6,860 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENCINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utalt 84078 * (801)
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WOEKSHEET

OPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 05/19/2005 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-36727

WELL NAME: SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18

OPERATOR: GASCO PRODUCTION ( N2575 )

CONTACT: VENESSA LANGMACHER PHONE NUMBER: 303-483-0044

PROPOSED LOCATION:

NENW 25 090S 180E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SURFACE· 0521 FNL 2122 FWL .

Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 0521 FNL 2122 FWL

UINTAH
Engineering

8 MILE FLAT NORTH ( 590 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: U-9803

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal
LATITUDE: 40.00780

PROPOSED FORMATION: BLKHK

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.8432

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

v Plat R649-2-3.

v Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] Unit
(No. UT-1233 )

Potash (Y/N) \/ R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No.43-1723 )
Drilling Unit

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:

(Date: ) Eff Date:

L Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS: th g
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0 0 4
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah May 19, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER Gasco Production Company
Executive Director

8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Division of Englewood, CO 80112

Oil, Gas & Mining

,.i, . Re: Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18 Well, 521' FNL, 2122' FWL, NE NW,
Sec. 25, T. 9 South, R. 18 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36727.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Acting Associate Director
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Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801)538-7458 •

0 0 4
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah May 19, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER Gasco Production Company
Executive Director

8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Division of Englewood, CO 80112

Oil, Gas & Mining

,.i, . Re: Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18 Well, 521' FNL, 2122' FWL, NE NW,
Sec. 25, T. 9 South, R. 18 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36727.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Acting Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801)538-7458 •



Operator: Gasco Production Company
Well Name & Number Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18

API Number: 43-047-36727
Lease: U-9803

Location: NE NW Sec. 25 T. 9 South R 18 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the
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Fonn 3160-3 FORM APPROVED

(September 2001) ---
-- OMB No. 1004-0136

- UNITED STATES Expires January 31, 2004

DEPARÏÏVÏENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.

BUREAUOFLANDMANAGEMENT MAY19 UÜ5 U-9803
6 If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER N/A
la. Type of Work: DRILL REENTER 7 If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.

b. Type of Well: On Wel Gas Well Other Single Zone Multiple Zone Sheep Wash Federal21-25-9-18

2. Name of Operator 303/483-0044 8 Inverness DriveEast, Suite 100 9. I Well N

Gasco Production Company Englewood,CO80112

3. Name of Agent 303/857-9999 14421County Road 10 ' 10. Field an Pool, or Exploratory

PermitCoInc. - Agent Fort Lupton, CO80621 Riverbend
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area

At surface 521' FNLand 2122' FWL Section 25, T9S - R18E
At proposed prod. zone NENW
14. Distance in miles and direction fiom nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately23.8milessoutheastofMyton,UT Uintah UT
15. Distance tiom proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit cedicated to this well

location to nearest
property or lease line, ft

- 521'(Also to nearest drig. unit line, if any) 1400.01 40 Acres

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, dnllmg, completed,
applied for, on this lease, ft Appf0X. 1100' 13,036' BondNo.UT-1233

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, ICDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4922' GL ASAP 35 Days
24. Attachments Igy ;

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this fonn:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized officer.

2 Signature Name (Printed/TPped)
' Date

gi M/k)' p BOYhâtflÀ/( I Venessa Langmacher 5/17/2005
Ti eAuthor° d Agentfor G Production Company gy
Ap (Si Name (Printed/TV O Date

Application approval does not wanant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable tine to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to

conduct operations thereon.

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212. make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false. fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*tinstructions on reverse)

DIVOFOIL,GAS&
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UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: GASCO Production Company Location: NENW, Sec 25, T9S, R18E
Well No: Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18 Lease No: UTU-9803
API No: 43-047-36727 Agreement: N/A

Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker Office:435-781-4490 Cell: 435-828-4470

Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee Office:435-781-4432 Cell: 435-828-7875

Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger Office:435-781-4502 Cell: 435-828-3913

Environmental Scientist: Paul Buhler Office:435-781-4475 Cell: 435-828-4029

Environmental Scientist: Karl Wright Office: 435-781-4484
Natural Resource Specialist: Holly Villa Office:435-781-4404
Natural Resource Specialist: Melissa Hawk Office:435-781-4476
After hours contact number: (435) 781-4513 FAX: (435) 781-4410

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with the applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application
for Permit to Drillincluding Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is
considered fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD
must be on location during construction, drilling, and completion operations.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and
(Notify Karl Wright) access roads.

Location Completion Prior to moving on the drilling rig.
(Notify Karl Wright)

Spud Notice -
Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.

(Notify PE)

Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and
(Notify Jamie Sparger) cementing all casing strings.

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
(Notify Jamie Sparger)

First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or
(Notify PE) production resumes after well has been off production for

more than ninety (90)
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Page 2 of 6
Well: Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18

1/26/2006

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

Surface Conditions of Approval or monitoringare listed in the Surface Use Plan of the APDs

• Within 90 calendar days of the approval date for this Application for Permit to Drill (APD),
the operator/lessee willsubmit to the Authorized Officer (AO),on Sundry Notice Form
3160-5, an Interim Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on well pads,
access roads, and pipelines. At a minimum,thiswill include the Best Management
Practice of the reshaping of the pad to the original contour to the extent possible; the
respreading of the top soil up to the rig anchor points; and, reseeding the area using
appropriate reclamation methods. The AO will provide written approval or concurrence
within 30 calendar days of receipt.

The interim seed mix for reclamation will be:

Crested Wheatgrass Agropyron cristatum 4 lbs. lacre

Western wheat grass Agropyron smithii 4 Ibs. lacre

Needle and thread grass Stipa comata 4 lbs. lacre

• If paleontologic materials are uncovered during construction, the operator shall
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials and contact the
Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will be made by the AO as to what mitigation
will be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material.

• Following well plugging and abandonment, the location, access roads, pipelines, and
other facilities shall be reclaimed. All disturbed surfaces shall be reshaped to
approximate the original contour; the top soil respread over the surface; and, the surface
revegetated. The surface of approved staging areas where construction activities did
not occur may require disking or ripping and

Page 2 of 6
Well: Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18

1/26/2006

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

Surface Conditions of Approval or monitoringare listed in the Surface Use Plan of the APDs

• Within 90 calendar days of the approval date for this Application for Permit to Drill (APD),
the operator/lessee willsubmit to the Authorized Officer (AO),on Sundry Notice Form
3160-5, an Interim Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on well pads,
access roads, and pipelines. At a minimum,thiswill include the Best Management
Practice of the reshaping of the pad to the original contour to the extent possible; the
respreading of the top soil up to the rig anchor points; and, reseeding the area using
appropriate reclamation methods. The AO will provide written approval or concurrence
within 30 calendar days of receipt.

The interim seed mix for reclamation will be:

Crested Wheatgrass Agropyron cristatum 4 lbs. lacre

Western wheat grass Agropyron smithii 4 Ibs. lacre

Needle and thread grass Stipa comata 4 lbs. lacre

• If paleontologic materials are uncovered during construction, the operator shall
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials and contact the
Authorized Officer (AO). A determination will be made by the AO as to what mitigation
will be necessary for the discovered paleontologic material.

• Following well plugging and abandonment, the location, access roads, pipelines, and
other facilities shall be reclaimed. All disturbed surfaces shall be reshaped to
approximate the original contour; the top soil respread over the surface; and, the surface
revegetated. The surface of approved staging areas where construction activities did
not occur may require disking or ripping and



Page 3 of 6
Well: Federal 21-25-9-18

1/23/2006

DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

AII provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly
adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
1. None.

DRILLINGICOMPLET10NIPRODUCINGOPERATINGSTANDARDS
1. There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover

program as approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. AIIwells,
whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.6. There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator,
lease serial number, well number, and surveyed description of the well. Any changes in
operation must have prior approval from the BLM, Vernal Field Office Petroleum
Engineers.

2. The spud date and time shall be reported orally to Vernal Field Officewithin 24 hours of
spudding.

3. Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineerinq Technician at least
24 hours in advance of casinq cementinq operations and BOPE & casinq pressure
tests.

4. Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) willremain in use untilthe well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls must remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all
times. Choke manifolds must be located outside of the rig substructure.

AIIBOPE components will be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in
the daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by
Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. AIIBOPE
pressure tests must be performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and J by the
rig pumps. Test must be reported in the driller's log.

BOP drillsmust be initiallyconducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out
from under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil& Gas
Order No. 2.

Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set
and cemented in place.

No aggressivelfresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

5. All shows of fresh water and minerals will be reported and protected. A sample will be
taken of any water flows and a water analysis furnished the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All
oil and gas shows will be adequately tested for commercial possibilities, reported, and
protected.

6. No location will be constructed or moved, no well willbe plugged, and no drilling or
workover equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended
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without prior approval of the BLM,Vernal Field Office. Ifoperations are to be suspended
for more than 30 days, prior approval of the BLM,Vernal Field Office must be obtained
and notification given before resumption of operations.

7. Chronologic drilling progress reports must be filed directly with the BLM, Vernal Field
Office on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers
until the well is completed.

Any change in the program must be approved by the BLM, Vernal Field Office. "Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells" (Form BLM3160-5) must be filed for all changes of plans
and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Emergency approval may be obtained orally,but such approval does not waive the
written report requirement. Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of
facilities, including roads, gathering lines, batteries, etc., which willresult in the
disturbance of new ground, will require the filing of a suitable plan pursuant to Onshore
Oil & Gas Order No. 1 of 43 CFR 3164.1 and prior approval by the BLM, Vernal Field
Office.

In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well must be reported on the "Monthly Report
of Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in
which operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically
plugged and abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals
Management Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-
525-7922 (303) 231-3650 for reporting information.

8. Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30
days after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all
other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or
completion operations, willbe filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well
completion report a geologic report including, at a minimum,formation tops, and a
summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys, sample descriptions, strip
logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if performed.
Samples (cuttings, fluid,and/orgas) willbe submitted only when requested by the BLM,
Vernal Field Office.

9. All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease will
have prior written approval from the BLM,Vernal Field Office.

All measurement points shall be identified as point of sales or allocation for royalty
determination prior to the installation of facilities.

10. Oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The Field Office
Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be
submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities willconform to the
API standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas
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Vernal Field Office.

9. All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease will
have prior written approval from the BLM,Vernal Field Office.

All measurement points shall be identified as point of sales or allocation for royalty
determination prior to the installation of facilities.

10. Oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The Field Office
Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be
submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities willconform to the
API standards for liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas
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11. A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
submitted to the BLM, Vernal Field Officewithin 30 days of installation or first production,
whichever occurs first. AIIsite security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas
Order No. 3 shall be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon
storage tanks will be effectively sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No.
3.

12. This APD is approved subject to the requirement that, should the well be successfully
completed for production, the BLM,Vernal Field office must be notified when it is placed
in a producing status. Such notification will be by written communication and must be
received in this office by not later than the fifth business day following the date on which
the well is placed on production. The notificationshall provide, as a minimum, the
following informational items:

a. Operator name, address, and telephone number.

b. Well name and number.

c. Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

d. Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production
for which royalty willbe paid).

e. The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and
casing head gas, or natural gas and entrained liquid
hydrocarbons).

f. The Federal or Iridian lease prefix and number on which the well
is located; otherwise the non-Federal or non-Indian land category,
i.e., State or private.

g. Unit agreement and / or participating area name and number, if
applicable.

h. Communitization agreement number, ifapplicable.

13. Anyventing or flaring of gas will be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A
and needs prior approval from Field Office Petroleum Engineers.

14. All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL
3A will be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events as defined in NTL3A,
will be reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days.
"Other than Major Events" will be reported in writingwithin 15 days. "Minor Events" will
be reported on the Monthly Report of Operations and Production.

15. Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A
permanent disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the
end of this 90-day period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed
permanent disposal method shall be submitted along withany necessary water
analyses, as soon as possible, but no later than 45 days after the date of first
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Any method of disposal which has not been approved prior to the end of the authorized
90-day period will be considered as an Incident of Noncompliance and willbe grounds
for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for disposing of said water is
provided and approved by this office.

16. Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field
Office Petroleum Engineers must be notifiedat least 24 hours in advance of the plugging
of the well, in order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is
suspended or abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled.
The "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within
30 days after the actual plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of
cement in each, and amount of casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface
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Form 9 STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING 6. Lease Designation and Serial Number
U-9803

7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Donotuse thisformforproposalstodrillnewwells,deepen existingwells,or to reenterpluggedand abandonedwells. 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement

Use APPLlCATIONFORPERMIT-- forsuch proposals N/A
1. Type of Well 9. Well Name and Number

O °',,, Ð Gaes Other (specify) SheepWash Federal#21-25-9-18
2. Name of Operator 10. API Well Number

Gasco Production Company 43-047-36727
3. Address of Operator 4. Telephone Number 11. Field and Pool, or Wildcat

8 Inverness DriveEast, Suite 100,Englewood,CO80112 303/483-0044 Riverbend
5. Location of Well

Footage : 521' FNLand2122'FWL County : Uintah
QQ, Sec, T., R., M. : NENWSection25 -R18E state : Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE XES TO INEICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Dup icate) (Submit Original Form Only)

Abandonment New Construction Abandonment * New Construction

Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing Casing Repair Pull or Alter Casing

Change of Plans Recompletion Change of Plans Shoot or Acidize

Conversion to Injection Shoot or Acidize Convers¡on to Injection Vent or Flare

Fracture Treat Vent or Flare Fracture Treat Water Shut-Off

Multiple Completion Water Shut-Off Other

Other Request 1 year extension of APD
Date of Work Completion

Approximate Date Work Will Start
Report results of Multiple Completions and Recompletions to different reservoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.
* Must be accompanied by a cement verification report.

13 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface

locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to thiswork.)

GascoProduction Companyrequests a oneyear extensionofthesubjectAPD.

"^ Approved by the
Utah Division of

Date

ameherebynca fy t e foregoing is tru d co

Title GSSco

PCrondsuctonnCormpany
Date 04/04/06

(State Use Only) RECEtVED

APRO6 2006
(8/90) See instructions on Reverse Side

DN,OF0\L,GAS&
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Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-36727
Well Name: Sheep Wash Federal #21-25-9-18
Location: NE NW Section 25, T9S - R18E
Company Permit Issued to: Gasco Production Company
Date Original Permit Issued: 5/19/2005

Theundersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Followinq is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If location on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes Noi

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? Yes No

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? Yes Noi

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? Yes No i

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? Yes Noi

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which would require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? Yes No

is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Yes No O

ppg( WA April4,2006
Venessa Langmach r - Permit nc. Date

Title: Consultant for Gasco Production Company

RECEIVED
APRO6 2006

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-36727
Well Name: Sheep Wash Federal #21-25-9-18
Location: NE NW Section 25, T9S - R18E
Company Permit Issued to: Gasco Production Company
Date Original Permit Issued: 5/19/2005
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Title: Consultant for Gasco Production Company

RECEIVED
APRO6 2006

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



JUN 30 2008 12:52 HP LASERJET 3200 P.2

STATE OF UTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GASAND MINING

ENTITYACTION FORM

Operator: Gasco Energy, Inc Operator Account Number: N 2575

Address: 8 Invemess Drive East, Suite 100

gg Englewood

state zip 80112 Phone Number. (303) 483-0044

Well i
API Number WellName CIO See Twp Rng County

4304736727 Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18 NENW 25 9 18 Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A 6/25/2006 ¿)g
Comments: Spud Well 00NF\lENT\AL

Wel 2
API Number Well Name GQ Sec Twp Rng County

4304736739 Federal 21-30-9-19 NENW 30 9 19 Uintah

Aedon Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Eritity Assignment
Number Number ERective Date

A 6/26/2006

Comments: Spud Well "" CONFilENTIAL
Well 3

API Number Wen Name 00 See Twp Rag County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single wellonly) Beveri atker

B - Add new weN to existingentity (groupor unitwell) lease Print)

C - Re-assign wel from one existingentity to another existing entity / A

D - Re-assign wel from one existing entity to a new entity ure

E - Other (Explainin 'comments'section) Engineering Tech
ElVED

JUN3 O2006
DIV.OFOIL,GAS&
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Form 3 160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMBNo 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires Jnovember30,2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803
Do not use th¡s forrn for proposals to cisiH or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 31643 (APD) for such proposals. NA

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Otfrer Instructions on reverse side

I. Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8. Wel1 Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18

Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 043-047-36727
8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado Bor12 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T, R . M ,
or Survey Description) Riverbend

NE NW of Section 25-T9S-R18E I 1. County or Parish, State
521' FNL &c2122' FWL

Uintah, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTlCE, REF3RT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize O Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
Alter Casing Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Q Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete Other NPffd
Change Plans O Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Conven to injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BlA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including æclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

This well was spud on 6/25/2oo6.

14. I herebycertify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Ty d) Title

Beverhi Walker Engineering Technician
Signature Date

«Jun€ 3O, 2000

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or Office
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse)

RECENED

JUL05 2006

DROFOL GAS&
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GASC0 .

Energy

AUS28 2006

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attn: Carol Daniels

August 25, 2006

Dear Ms Daniels:

Gasco Production Company will soon be drilling the Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18,
NENW 25-9S-18E, Uintah County, Utah. The API Number for this well is 43-047-

36727.

Gasco wishes to keep all information on this well CONFIDENTIAL for as long a period
as possible.

Yours truly,

Robin Dean
Geological Manager
Gasco Energy, Inc.

GASCOEnergy, Inc.
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100 Tel: (303) 483-0044 Email: invest@gascoenergy.com

Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: (303) 483-0011 Website:www.gascoenergy.com AMEX:
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GASCO GASCO ENERGY 54 ige s --

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT 2 3027
AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/8/2006
Current Operations: DERRICK REPAIR.
Depth: 3520' KEProg: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation:
DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $144,862 CWC: $597,718
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ 127,000
PVIYP: #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 7,437
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 6,300
Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ 2,400 water: $ 600
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging:

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Coment: $ -

Chlor SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Dowr: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

6:00 21:00 15:00 RIG REP/ IR - REPAIR DERRICK. Misc. I Labor: $ -

21:00 00:30 3:30 RIG UP FLOOR cag.crew: $ -

00:30 06:00 5:30 PU KELLY,MAKEUP KELLY,K.VALVE,AND SAVER SUB. Daily Total: $ 144,862
cum.wtr: $ 600
Cum. Fuel $ 16,500
Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
iss 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 1
Survey

P/U LITH: BKG GAS
SIO FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEPf 520tE

DIVOFOIL,GAS&

GASCO GASCO ENERGY 54 ige s --

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT 2 3027
AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/8/2006
Current Operations: DERRICK REPAIR.
Depth: 3520' KEProg: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation:
DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $144,862 CWC: $597,718
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ 127,000
PVIYP: #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 7,437
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 6,300
Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ 2,400 water: $ 600
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging:

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Coment: $ -

Chlor SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Dowr: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

6:00 21:00 15:00 RIG REP/ IR - REPAIR DERRICK. Misc. I Labor: $ -

21:00 00:30 3:30 RIG UP FLOOR cag.crew: $ -

00:30 06:00 5:30 PU KELLY,MAKEUP KELLY,K.VALVE,AND SAVER SUB. Daily Total: $ 144,862
cum.wtr: $ 600
Cum. Fuel $ 16,500
Cum. Bits: $ -

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
iss 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 1
Survey

P/U LITH: BKG GAS
SIO FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEPf 520tE

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



GASC0 GASCO ENERGY Tofs
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3 of 2--3C'78 7

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/8/2006 1

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 4243' Prog: 723 |D Hrs: 12 AV ROP: 60.3 |Formation: GREEN RIVER
DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $24,558 CWC: $622,276
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRL(i FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: R #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: DSX516M int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HYC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: S GPM : 381 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: H Press: 920 Jets: 5-18,2-14 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: W Av oc: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: A Av DP: 337 Depth In: 3520 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T JetVel: 109 FTG: 723' Tanks: $ - Logging:

PflMf E ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 12 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: R sPR el : 54-180 FPH: 60.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : SPR#2: WOB: 15-20 Pumping UT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,200
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 20 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Dowr: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 mae: $ - consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 12.0 DaHy Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

06:00 9:00 3:00 FINISH RI 3GING TO DRILL Misc. I Labor: $ -

9:00 12:00 3:00 DRILLFLOAT,CEMENT, AND SHOE, RAN LEAKOFF TEST cap. crew: $ -

12:00 06:00 18:00 DRLG 3520' - 4293' (773', 64.4 FPH). Daily Total: $ 24,558
cum.wtr: $ 600
Cum. Fuei $ 16,500

SPUD 7-7/8" HOLE AT 18:00, 9/8/2006. cum.Bits: $ -

RAN LEAKOFF TEST AT 3579', 500#I15 MIN.,OK BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBs 1 6.83
Dc 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey
Survey

PIU 115 K# LITH: BKG GAS 46
SIO 105 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 51
ROT. 110 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 763 On Hand: 6472 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEPi 5 2006

DIVOFOIL,GAS&

GASC0 GASCO ENERGY Tofs
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3 of 2--3C'78 7

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/8/2006 1

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 4243' Prog: 723 |D Hrs: 12 AV ROP: 60.3 |Formation: GREEN RIVER
DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $24,558 CWC: $622,276
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRL(i FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: R #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: DSX516M int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HYC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: S GPM : 381 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: H Press: 920 Jets: 5-18,2-14 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: W Av oc: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: A Av DP: 337 Depth In: 3520 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T JetVel: 109 FTG: 723' Tanks: $ - Logging:

PflMf E ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 12 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: R sPR el : 54-180 FPH: 60.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : SPR#2: WOB: 15-20 Pumping UT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,200
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: 20 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Dowr: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 mae: $ - consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 12.0 DaHy Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

06:00 9:00 3:00 FINISH RI 3GING TO DRILL Misc. I Labor: $ -

9:00 12:00 3:00 DRILLFLOAT,CEMENT, AND SHOE, RAN LEAKOFF TEST cap. crew: $ -

12:00 06:00 18:00 DRLG 3520' - 4293' (773', 64.4 FPH). Daily Total: $ 24,558
cum.wtr: $ 600
Cum. Fuei $ 16,500

SPUD 7-7/8" HOLE AT 18:00, 9/8/2006. cum.Bits: $ -

RAN LEAKOFF TEST AT 3579', 500#I15 MIN.,OK BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBs 1 6.83
Dc 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey
Survey

PIU 115 K# LITH: BKG GAS 46

SIO 105 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 51
ROT. 110 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 763 On Hand: 6472 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEPi 5 2006

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



GASCO GASCO ENERGY re le
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/10/2006 2

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 4800' Prog: 557 D Hrs: 21 1/2 AV ROP: 25.9 |Formation: GREEN RIVER
DMC: $11,388 TMC: $24,276 TDC: $25,508 CWC: $623,226
Contract¢ r: Mud Co: M-IDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: R #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: DSX516M int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: S GPM : 381 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: H Press: 920 Jets: 5-18,2-14 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: W AV DC: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: A AV DP: 337 Depth In: 3520 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T Jetvel: 109 FTG: 1280' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: E ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 33.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: R SPR #1 : 54-175 FPH: 38.2 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: 25-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,150
Dapp ppb: Stm.Up: 20 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Dowr : Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 33.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

06:00 15:30 9:30 DRLG42< 3' - 4497' (254', 26.7 F >H). Misc. I Labor: $ -

15:30 16:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

16:00 20:00 4:00 DRLG4497' - 4561' (64', 32 FPH). Daily Total: $ 25,508
20:00 21:00 1:00 WIRELINESURVEY, MISSRUN cum.wtr· $ 600
21:00 22:00 1:00 DRLG4561' - 4593' (32', 32 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 16,500
22:00 22:30 0:30 WIRELINESURVEY, MISSRUN cum.Bits: $ -

22:30 00:00 1:30 DRLG4593' - 4625' (32', 21.3 FPH). BHA

00:00 00:30 0:30 WIRELINESURVEY, MISSRUN BIT 1 1.00

00:30 06:00 5:30 DRLG 4625' - 4800' (175', 31.8 FPH). 0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey
Survey

PIU 125 K# LITH: 75% SH, 10% SS, 10% SLTSTN, 5% CLYST BKG GAS 25
SIO 107 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 160
ROT. 120 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 250
FUEL Used: 788 On Hand: 5684 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEPf 5 2008

DIVOFOIL,GAS&

GASCO GASCO ENERGY re le

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT
AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/10/2006 2

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 4800' Prog: 557 D Hrs: 21 1/2 AV ROP: 25.9 |Formation: GREEN RIVER
DMC: $11,388 TMC: $24,276 TDC: $25,508 CWC: $623,226
Contract¢ r: Mud Co: M-IDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: R #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: DSX516M int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: S GPM : 381 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: H Press: 920 Jets: 5-18,2-14 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: W AV DC: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: A AV DP: 337 Depth In: 3520 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T Jetvel: 109 FTG: 1280' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: E ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 33.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: R SPR #1 : 54-175 FPH: 38.2 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: 25-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,150
Dapp ppb: Stm.Up: 20 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Dowr : Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 33.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

06:00 15:30 9:30 DRLG42< 3' - 4497' (254', 26.7 F >H). Misc. I Labor: $ -

15:30 16:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

16:00 20:00 4:00 DRLG4497' - 4561' (64', 32 FPH). Daily Total: $ 25,508
20:00 21:00 1:00 WIRELINESURVEY, MISSRUN cum.wtr· $ 600
21:00 22:00 1:00 DRLG4561' - 4593' (32', 32 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 16,500
22:00 22:30 0:30 WIRELINESURVEY, MISSRUN cum.Bits: $ -

22:30 00:00 1:30 DRLG4593' - 4625' (32', 21.3 FPH). BHA

00:00 00:30 0:30 WIRELINESURVEY, MISSRUN BIT 1 1.00

00:30 06:00 5:30 DRLG 4625' - 4800' (175', 31.8 FPH). 0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey
Survey

PIU 125 K# LITH: 75% SH, 10% SS, 10% SLTSTN, 5% CLYST BKG GAS 25
SIO 107 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 160
ROT. 120 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 250
FUEL Used: 788 On Hand: 5684 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEPf 5 2008

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



GASCO GASCO ENERGY 7-0is y

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT
'~ pcyp

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/11/2006 2
Current Operations: 3
Depth: 5032' Prog: 232 |D Hrs: 18 |AV ROP: 12.9 |Formation: GREEN RIVER
DMC: $1,237 TMC: $25,512 TDC: $34,158 CWC: $631,876
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRLM FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 ppm Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" surr.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: R #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: DSX516M HC504ZX int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HYC HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: S GPM : 381 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: H Press: 920 Jets: 5-18,2-14 6-16 well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: W Av oc: 204 To out: 5032 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: A AV DP: 337 Depth In: 3520 5032 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T Jetvel: 109 FTG: 1512' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf· E ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 33.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: R sPR oi : 54-175 FPH: 45.1 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000
ca : 100 SPR #2 : WOB: 25-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,800
Dapp ppb: 5.7 Btm.Up: 20 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover. $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 33.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

06:00 14:30 8:30 DRLG48( O' - 4912' (112', 13.2 F H). Misc. I Labor: $ -

14:30 15:30 1:00 RUN WIRELINESURVEY, RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMSAND HC cag.crew: $ -

15:30 01:00 9:30 DRLG4912'- 5032' (120', 12.6 FPH). Daily Total: $ 34,158
01:00 02:00 1:00 MIXAND PUMP PILL cum.wtr: $ 600
02:00 05:00 3:00 POOH FOR BIT#2 Cum. Fuel $ 16,500
05:00 06:00 1:00 CO BITAND CHECK WEAR BUSHING Cum. Bits: $ 18,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
oc 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 3°

Survey
PIU 130 K# LITH: 85% SH, 15% SS BKG GAS 20
SIO 118 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 60
ROT. 125 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 215
FUEL Used: 927 On Hand: 4757 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEPf 5 2008

DIVOFOIL,GAS&

GASCO GASCO ENERGY 7-0is y

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT
'~ pcyp

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/11/2006 2
Current Operations: 3
Depth: 5032' Prog: 232 |D Hrs: 18 |AV ROP: 12.9 |Formation: GREEN RIVER
DMC: $1,237 TMC: $25,512 TDC: $34,158 CWC: $631,876
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRLM FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 ppm Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" surr.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: R #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: DSX516M HC504ZX int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HYC HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: S GPM : 381 SIN: JW6129 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: H Press: 920 Jets: 5-18,2-14 6-16 well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: W Av oc: 204 To out: 5032 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: A AV DP: 337 Depth In: 3520 5032 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T Jetvel: 109 FTG: 1512' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf· E ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 33.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: R sPR oi : 54-175 FPH: 45.1 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000
ca : 100 SPR #2 : WOB: 25-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,800
Dapp ppb: 5.7 Btm.Up: 20 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover. $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 33.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

06:00 14:30 8:30 DRLG48( O' - 4912' (112', 13.2 F H). Misc. I Labor: $ -

14:30 15:30 1:00 RUN WIRELINESURVEY, RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMSAND HC cag.crew: $ -

15:30 01:00 9:30 DRLG4912'- 5032' (120', 12.6 FPH). Daily Total: $ 34,158
01:00 02:00 1:00 MIXAND PUMP PILL cum.wtr: $ 600
02:00 05:00 3:00 POOH FOR BIT#2 Cum. Fuel $ 16,500
05:00 06:00 1:00 CO BITAND CHECK WEAR BUSHING Cum. Bits: $ 18,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
oc 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 3°

Survey
PIU 130 K# LITH: 85% SH, 15% SS BKG GAS 20
SIO 118 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 60
ROT. 125 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 215
FUEL Used: 927 On Hand: 4757 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEPf 5 2008

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



GASCO GASCO ENERGY 7 NC

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT
AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/12/2006 4

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 6107' Prog: 1075 |D Hrs: 18 |AV ROP: 59.7 Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $609 TMC: $26,122 TDC: $35,907 CWC: $739,474
Contracts r: Mud Co: M-IDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

Mw: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PviYP: R #2 F-1000 3.5 g Type: HC504ZX int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: S GPM : 381 SIN: 7110877 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,140

Cake: H Press: 920 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: W Av oc: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: A Av DP: 337 Depth In: 5032 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T JetVel: 109 FTG: 1075' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: E Eco: 8.63 Hrs: 33.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor R sPR el : 54-175 FPH: 32.1 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000
ca : 100 SPR #2 : WOB: 25-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,800
Dapp ppb: 5 stm.up: 20 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 33.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 609
06:00 9:30 3:30 TIH W/ BI #2 Misc. I Labor $ -

9:30 10:00 0:30 WASH AND REAM90' TO BTM cag.crew: $ -

10:00 02:00 16:00 DRLG 5032 - 5991' (959', 59.9 FPH). Daily Total: $ 35,907
02:00 03:00 1:00 MIXAND PUMP PILL cum.wtr: $ 600
03:00 06:00 3:00 DRLG 5991' - 6107' (116', 38.6 FPH). Cum. Fue: $ 16,500

cum.sits: $ 18,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 4878'
Survey 3° 5910'

PIU 145 K# LITH: 90% SH, 10% SS BKG GAS 10
SIO 135 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 15
ROT. 142 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 3520' KB PEAK GAS 640
FUEL Used: 798 On Hand: 3959 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP15 2008

GASCO GASCO ENERGY 7 NC

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT
AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/12/2006 4

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 6107' Prog: 1075 |D Hrs: 18 |AV ROP: 59.7 Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $609 TMC: $26,122 TDC: $35,907 CWC: $739,474
Contracts r: Mud Co: M-IDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

Mw: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PviYP: R #2 F-1000 3.5 g Type: HC504ZX int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: S GPM : 381 SIN: 7110877 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 1,140

Cake: H Press: 920 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: W Av oc: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: A Av DP: 337 Depth In: 5032 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T JetVel: 109 FTG: 1075' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: E Eco: 8.63 Hrs: 33.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor R sPR el : 54-175 FPH: 32.1 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000
ca : 100 SPR #2 : WOB: 25-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,800
Dapp ppb: 5 stm.up: 20 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 33.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 609
06:00 9:30 3:30 TIH W/ BI #2 Misc. I Labor $ -

9:30 10:00 0:30 WASH AND REAM90' TO BTM cag.crew: $ -

10:00 02:00 16:00 DRLG 5032 - 5991' (959', 59.9 FPH). Daily Total: $ 35,907
02:00 03:00 1:00 MIXAND PUMP PILL cum.wtr: $ 600
03:00 06:00 3:00 DRLG 5991' - 6107' (116', 38.6 FPH). Cum. Fue: $ 16,500

cum.sits: $ 18,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 4878'

Survey 3° 5910'

PIU 145 K# LITH: 90% SH, 10% SS BKG GAS 10
SIO 135 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 15
ROT. 142 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 3520' KB PEAK GAS 640
FUEL Used: 798 On Hand: 3959 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP15 2008



GASCO GASCO ENERGY To
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3-d -34 ¿q

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/13/2006 5

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 7880' Prog: 1773 |D Hrs: 23 |AV ROP: 77.1 |Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $360 TMC: $26,482 TDC: $34,929 CWC: $738,496
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLt; FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: R
s¯

F-1000 8.5 gpm Type: HC504ZX int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: S GPM 381 SIN: 7110877 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 651
Cake: H Press: 920 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 7,223
Solids: W AV DC: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: A AV DP: 337 Depth In: 5032 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T JetVel: 109 FTG: 2848' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: E ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 41 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: R SPR #1 : FPH: 69.5 Heater. $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 80 SPR #2 : 46-210 wos: 25-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,300
Dapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 25 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ok Dowr: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 93.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 360

06:00 18:30 12:30 DRLG 61( 7' - 7137' (1030', 82.4 PH). Misc. I Labor $ 1,037
18:30 19:00 0:30 RUN WIRELINESURVEY, 3° @7056 cap.crew: $ -

19:00 04:00 9:00 DRLG 7137' - 7802' (665', 73.9 FPH). Daily Total: $ 34,929
04:00 04:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cum.wtr $ 7,823
04:30 06:00 1:30 DRLG 7802' - 7880' (78', 52 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 16,500

cum.sits: $ 18,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM i 33.01
les 1 6.83
Dc 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 5910'
Survey 3° 7056'

PIU 175 K# LITH: 80% SH, 15% SS, 5% SLTST BKG GAS 15
SIO 163 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 32
ROT. 173 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 8/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 53
FUEL Used: 904 On Hand: 3055 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP15 20¾

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

GASCO GASCO ENERGY To
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3-d -34 ¿q

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/13/2006 5

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 7880' Prog: 1773 |D Hrs: 23 |AV ROP: 77.1 |Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $360 TMC: $26,482 TDC: $34,929 CWC: $738,496
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLt; FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt #: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: R
s¯

F-1000 8.5 gpm Type: HC504ZX int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: S GPM 381 SIN: 7110877 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 651
Cake: H Press: 920 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 7,223
Solids: W AV DC: 204 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: A AV DP: 337 Depth In: 5032 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T JetVel: 109 FTG: 2848' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: E ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 41 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: R SPR #1 : FPH: 69.5 Heater. $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 80 SPR #2 : 46-210 wos: 25-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,300
Dapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 25 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ok Dowr: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 93.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 360

06:00 18:30 12:30 DRLG 61( 7' - 7137' (1030', 82.4 PH). Misc. I Labor $ 1,037
18:30 19:00 0:30 RUN WIRELINESURVEY, 3° @7056 cap.crew: $ -

19:00 04:00 9:00 DRLG 7137' - 7802' (665', 73.9 FPH). Daily Total: $ 34,929
04:00 04:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cum.wtr $ 7,823
04:30 06:00 1:30 DRLG 7802' - 7880' (78', 52 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 16,500

cum.sits: $ 18,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM i 33.01
les 1 6.83
Dc 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 5910'
Survey 3° 7056'

PIU 175 K# LITH: 80% SH, 15% SS, 5% SLTST BKG GAS 15
SIO 163 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 32
ROT. 173 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 8/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 53
FUEL Used: 904 On Hand: 3055 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP15 20¾

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



GASCO GASCO ENERGY of if/

Ener DAILYDRILLING REPORT 3mv2- Sá?a
AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/14/2006 6

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 8755' Prog: 875 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 37.2 Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $2,213 TMC: $28,694 TDC: $42,810 CWC: $817,313
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLil FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt s: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: R #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC504ZX int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: S GPM : 381 SIN: 7110877 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: H Press: 1550 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water $ -

solida: W AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 14,889
Sand: A Av DP: 298 Depth In: 5032 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T JetVel: 106 FTG: 3723' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: E ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 64.5 Separator: $ - Coment: $ -

Chlor R SPR #1 : FPH: 57.7 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 80 SPR #2 : 46-150 wos: 25-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 40 R-RPM: 45 Prime Mover $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Dowr: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 117.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,213

06:00 10:30 4:30 DRLG 784 O' - 8153' (273', 60.7 F >H). Misc. I Labor $ -

10:30 11:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

11:00 06:00 19:00 DRLG 8153' - 8755' (602', 31.7 FPH). Daily Total: $ 42,810
cum.wtr: $ 7,823
cum.Fuei $ 31,389
cum.sit.: $ 18,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 5910'
Survey 3° 7056'

PIU 190 K# LITH: 60% SH, 40% SS BKG GAS 10
SIO 175 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 20
ROT. 185 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 660
FUEL Used: 698 On Hand: 6857 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP15 2008

DIVOF0lL,GAS&

GASCO GASCO ENERGY of if/

Ener DAILYDRILLING REPORT 3mv2- Sá?a
AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/14/2006 6

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 8755' Prog: 875 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 37.2 Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $2,213 TMC: $28,694 TDC: $42,810 CWC: $817,313
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLil FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 8.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt s: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: F SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: R #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC504ZX int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: E SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: S GPM : 381 SIN: 7110877 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: H Press: 1550 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water $ -

solida: W AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 14,889
Sand: A Av DP: 298 Depth In: 5032 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : T JetVel: 106 FTG: 3723' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: E ECD: 8.63 Hrs: 64.5 Separator: $ - Coment: $ -

Chlor R SPR #1 : FPH: 57.7 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 80 SPR #2 : 46-150 wos: 25-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 40 R-RPM: 45 Prime Mover $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Dowr: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 117.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,213

06:00 10:30 4:30 DRLG 784 O' - 8153' (273', 60.7 F >H). Misc. I Labor $ -

10:30 11:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

11:00 06:00 19:00 DRLG 8153' - 8755' (602', 31.7 FPH). Daily Total: $ 42,810
cum.wtr: $ 7,823
cum.Fuei $ 31,389
cum.sit.: $ 18,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 5910'
Survey 3° 7056'

PIU 190 K# LITH: 60% SH, 40% SS BKG GAS 10
SIO 175 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 20
ROT. 185 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 660
FUEL Used: 698 On Hand: 6857 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP15 2008

DIVOF0lL,GAS&



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3-69'L sy.yp

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109* 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/15/2006 7

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 9274' Prog: 519 |D Hrs: 23 1/2 |AV ROP: 22.1 |Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $13,043 TMC: $41,738 TDC: $39,402 CWC: $856,715
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLO FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 9.4 si F-loo0 3.5 ppm Bit s: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 39 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 9/13 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: HC504ZX Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: 10/27/35 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 16 GPM : 381 SIN: 7110877 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 651
Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 7 Av oc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 5032 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 4242' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2/7 ECD: 9.7 Hrs: 88 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 48.2 Heater $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 46-210 wos: 30-35 Pumping uT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 42 R-RPM: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 140.5 Daily Total: $ - DriHing Mud: $ 13,043

06:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG8705' - 8979' (224', 34.5 FPH). Misc. I Labor $ -

12:30 13:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

13:00 06:00 17:00 DRLG8979'- 9274' (295', 17.4 FPH). Daily Total: $ 39,402
cum.wtr $ 7,823
Cum. Fuel $ 31,389
cum.sits: $ 18,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 5910'
Survey 3° 7056'

PIU 195 K# LITH: 20% SH, 40% SS, 40% LS BKG GAS 6
SIO 185 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 20

ROT. 190 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 34
FUEL Used: 1040 On Hand: 5817 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP15 2006

DIVOF0lL,GAS&

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3-69'L sy.yp

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109* 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/15/2006 7

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 9274' Prog: 519 |D Hrs: 23 1/2 |AV ROP: 22.1 |Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $13,043 TMC: $41,738 TDC: $39,402 CWC: $856,715
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLO FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 9.4 si F-loo0 3.5 ppm Bit s: 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 39 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 9/13 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: HC504ZX Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: 10/27/35 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 16 GPM : 381 SIN: 7110877 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 651
Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 7 Av oc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 5032 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 4242' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2/7 ECD: 9.7 Hrs: 88 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 48.2 Heater $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 46-210 wos: 30-35 Pumping uT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 42 R-RPM: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 140.5 Daily Total: $ - DriHing Mud: $ 13,043

06:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG8705' - 8979' (224', 34.5 FPH). Misc. I Labor $ -

12:30 13:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMS AND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

13:00 06:00 17:00 DRLG8979'- 9274' (295', 17.4 FPH). Daily Total: $ 39,402
cum.wtr $ 7,823
Cum. Fuel $ 31,389
cum.sits: $ 18,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 5910'
Survey 3° 7056'

PIU 195 K# LITH: 20% SH, 40% SS, 40% LS BKG GAS 6
SIO 185 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 20

ROT. 190 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 34
FUEL Used: 1040 On Hand: 5817 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP15 2006

DIVOF0lL,GAS&



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT Sc4 34 Mf

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/16/2006 8

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 9327' Prog: 53 D Hrs: 7 1/2 AV ROP: 7.1 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $1,489 TMC: $43,227 TDC: $35,248 CWC: $891,963
Contractor: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 39 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 12/18 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC504ZX HC506Z Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: 13/35/45 SPM: MFG: HTC HTC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 16 GPM: 381 SIN: 7110877 7106158 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 651
Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-16 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 8 AV DC: 200 TD Out: 9325 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 5032 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 4295' 2' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2/10 ECD: 9.7 Hrs: 88 1 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 48.8 2.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000
ca : 100 SPR #2 : 46-210 wos: 30-35 2-7 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 750
Dapp ppb: 5.8 Btm.Up: 42 R-RPM: 45 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 148.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,489

06:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG92 r 4' - 9327' (53', 8.2 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

12:30 13:30 1:00 MIXAND PUMP PILL,DROPPED SURVEY cag.crew: $ -

13:30 14:30 1:00 LD 10 JTS. DP Daily Total: $ 35,248
14:30 19:30 5:00 POOH FOR BIT#3, STOP i HR. FOR WEATHER cum.wtr: $ 7,823
19:30 21:00 1:30 CHANGE OUT MM& BIT, CHECKWEARBUSHING, OK Cum. Fuel $ 31,389
21:00 04:00 7:00 TIH PICKINGUP 10 JTS. HARDBANDED DP cum.Bits: $ 27,000

04:00 05:00 1:00 WASH AND REAM 90' TO BTM. BHA

05:00 06:00 1:00 DRLG 9274' - 9327' (53', 8.2 FPH). BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40

½ECEIVED IBS 1 6.53

SEP i s ¿006
DC 17 523.41

DIV.OFÖll,UAb&MINING TOTAL BHA = 601.18

Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

P/U 195 K# LITH: 40% SH, 60% SS BKG GAS 500

S/O 185 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 190 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 930 On Hand: 4887 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT Sc4 34 Mf

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/16/2006 8

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 9327' Prog: 53 D Hrs: 7 1/2 AV ROP: 7.1 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $1,489 TMC: $43,227 TDC: $35,248 CWC: $891,963
Contractor: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 2 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 39 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 12/18 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC504ZX HC506Z Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: 13/35/45 SPM: MFG: HTC HTC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 16 GPM: 381 SIN: 7110877 7106158 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 651
Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-16 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 8 AV DC: 200 TD Out: 9325 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 5032 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 4295' 2' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2/10 ECD: 9.7 Hrs: 88 1 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 48.8 2.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000
ca : 100 SPR #2 : 46-210 wos: 30-35 2-7 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 750
Dapp ppb: 5.8 Btm.Up: 42 R-RPM: 45 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
Total Rot. Hrs: 148.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,489

06:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG92 r 4' - 9327' (53', 8.2 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

12:30 13:30 1:00 MIXAND PUMP PILL,DROPPED SURVEY cag.crew: $ -

13:30 14:30 1:00 LD 10 JTS. DP Daily Total: $ 35,248
14:30 19:30 5:00 POOH FOR BIT#3, STOP i HR. FOR WEATHER cum.wtr: $ 7,823
19:30 21:00 1:30 CHANGE OUT MM& BIT, CHECKWEARBUSHING, OK Cum. Fuel $ 31,389
21:00 04:00 7:00 TIH PICKINGUP 10 JTS. HARDBANDED DP cum.Bits: $ 27,000

04:00 05:00 1:00 WASH AND REAM 90' TO BTM. BHA

05:00 06:00 1:00 DRLG 9274' - 9327' (53', 8.2 FPH). BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40

½ECEIVED IBS 1 6.53

SEP i s ¿006
DC 17 523.41

DIV.OFÖll,UAb&MINING TOTAL BHA = 601.18

Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

P/U 195 K# LITH: 40% SH, 60% SS BKG GAS 500

S/O 185 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 190 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 930 On Hand: 4887 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY 75 </ges.--g

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT L/3-Ogg -

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/17/2006 9

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 9630' Prog: 356 D Hrs: 7 1/2 AV ROP: 47.5 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,001 TMC: $45,228 TDC: $35,109 CWC: $891,824
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLA FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 9.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 40 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: 15/35/46 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 13.5 GPM : 381 SIN: 7106158 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 8 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 305' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2/10 ECD: 9.7 Hrs: 24.5 Separator: $ - Coment: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 12.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000
ca : 100 SPR #2 : 46-300 wos: 10-14 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 750
Dapp ppb: 5.2 stm.up: 42 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 171.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,001

06:00 15:30 9:30 DRLG93 7' - 9485' (158', 16.6 F:'H). Misc. I Labor: $ -

15:30 16:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag. crew: $ -

16:00 06:00 14:00 DRLG9485' - 9630' (145', 10.4 FPH). Daily Total: $ 35,109
cum.wtr: $ 7,823
Cum. Fuel $ 31,389
cum.Bits: $ 27,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00

#2 DRAWWORKSMOTOR DOWN, WAITINGON MECHANIC 0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBs 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53

R EIVED DC 17 523.41

SEP19 2ngs
TOTAL BHA = 601.18

IJlv.DEGIL,GAS&MINigg Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

P/U 195 K# LITH: 40% SH, 60% SS BKG GAS 60
S/O 185 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 200
ROT. 190 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 440
FUEL Used: 1059 On Hand: 3828 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP

GASCO GASCO ENERGY 75 </ges.--g

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT L/3-Ogg -

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/17/2006 9

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 9630' Prog: 356 D Hrs: 7 1/2 AV ROP: 47.5 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,001 TMC: $45,228 TDC: $35,109 CWC: $891,824
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLA FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 9.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 40 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: 15/35/46 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 13.5 GPM : 381 SIN: 7106158 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 8 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 305' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2/10 ECD: 9.7 Hrs: 24.5 Separator: $ - Coment: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 12.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000
ca : 100 SPR #2 : 46-300 wos: 10-14 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 750
Dapp ppb: 5.2 stm.up: 42 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: 171.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,001

06:00 15:30 9:30 DRLG93 7' - 9485' (158', 16.6 F:'H). Misc. I Labor: $ -

15:30 16:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag. crew: $ -

16:00 06:00 14:00 DRLG9485' - 9630' (145', 10.4 FPH). Daily Total: $ 35,109
cum.wtr: $ 7,823
Cum. Fuel $ 31,389
cum.Bits: $ 27,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00

#2 DRAWWORKSMOTOR DOWN, WAITINGON MECHANIC 0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBs 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53

R EIVED DC 17 523.41

SEP19 2ngs
TOTAL BHA = 601.18

IJlv.DEGIL,GAS&MINigg Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

P/U 195 K# LITH: 40% SH, 60% SS BKG GAS 60
S/O 185 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 200
ROT. 190 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 440

FUEL Used: 1059 On Hand: 3828 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP



GASCO GASCO ENERGY ; 5 If /sc S

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT y -3 V9- -3 4 9g
AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/18/2006 10

Current Operations: DOWNTIME,WAIT ON NEW TORQUE CONVERTER
Depth: 9736' Prog: 106 |D Hrs: 11 AV ROP: 9.6 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $1,089 TMC: $46,317 TDC: $25,547 CWC: $882,262
Contractor: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 40 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: 15/35/46 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 13.5 GPM : 381 SIN: 7106158 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 8 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 411' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2/10 ECD: 9.7 Hrs: 35.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 11.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 46-300 wos: 8-14 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,100
Dapp ppb: 5.2 stm.up: 42 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
10 Total Rot. Hrs: 182.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,089

06:00 17:00 11:00 DRLG96:3' - 9736' (106', 9.7 FP .
Misc. I Labor $ -

17:00 17:30 0:30 MIX AND PUMP PILL cag.crew: $ -

17:30 20:00 2:30 POOH TO 3500'. Daily Total: $ 25,547

20:00 06:00 10:00 DOWN TIME, WAIT ON NEW TORQUE CONVERTER cum.wtr: $ 7,823
Cum. Fuel $ 31,389
cum.Bits: $ 27,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00

#2 DRAWWORKSMOTOR DOWN, WAITING ON TORQUE CONVERT 0.13 MM i 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53

RFCFIVFO DC 17 523.41

a.P i 9 2005
TOTAL BHA = 601.18

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 195 K# LITH: 40% SH, 60% SS BKG GAS 60
SIO 185 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 200

ROT. 190 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 440
FUEL Used: 1059 On Hand: 3828 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP

GASCO GASCO ENERGY ; 5 If /sc S

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT y -3 V9- -3 4 9g
AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/18/2006 10

Current Operations: DOWNTIME,WAIT ON NEW TORQUE CONVERTER
Depth: 9736' Prog: 106 |D Hrs: 11 AV ROP: 9.6 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $1,089 TMC: $46,317 TDC: $25,547 CWC: $882,262
Contractor: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 40 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833
Gel: 15/35/46 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 13.5 GPM : 381 SIN: 7106158 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 8 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 411' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2/10 ECD: 9.7 Hrs: 35.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 11.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 46-300 wos: 8-14 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,100
Dapp ppb: 5.2 stm.up: 42 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
10 Total Rot. Hrs: 182.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,089

06:00 17:00 11:00 DRLG96:3' - 9736' (106', 9.7 FP .
Misc. I Labor $ -

17:00 17:30 0:30 MIX AND PUMP PILL cag.crew: $ -

17:30 20:00 2:30 POOH TO 3500'. Daily Total: $ 25,547

20:00 06:00 10:00 DOWN TIME, WAIT ON NEW TORQUE CONVERTER cum.wtr: $ 7,823
Cum. Fuel $ 31,389
cum.Bits: $ 27,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00

#2 DRAWWORKSMOTOR DOWN, WAITING ON TORQUE CONVERT 0.13 MM i 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53

RFCFIVFO DC 17 523.41

a.P i 9 2005
TOTAL BHA = 601.18

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 195 K# LITH: 40% SH, 60% SS BKG GAS 60
SIO 185 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 200

ROT. 190 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 440

FUEL Used: 1059 On Hand: 3828 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP



GASCO GASCO ENERGY og ,
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT ;-o p- 3C ygg

AFE # 40118 GS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/19/2006 11
Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 9810' Prog: 74 D Hrs: 7 AV ROP: 10.6 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $488 TMC: $46,805 TDC: $10,498 CWC: $945,751
Contractt-r: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLECOST
Mw: 9.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt #: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 40 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. cag: $ - oayRate: $ 5,785
Gel: 15/35/46 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: 13.5 GPM : 381 SIN: 7106158 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 8 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 485' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2/10 ECD: 9.7 Hrs: 42 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 11.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 46-300 wos: 8-14 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 700
Dapp ppb: 5.2 Btm.Up: 42 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 189.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 488
06:00 12:00 6:00 DOWN TIAE, WAITON NEW TORQUE COP VERTER Misc.l Labor: $ -

12:00 19:30 7:30 REPLACE TORQUE CONVERTER ON #2 DW MOTOR csg.crew: $ -

19:30 21:30 2:00 TIH Daily Total: $ 10,498
21:30 23:00 1:30 WASH AND REAM 90' TO BTM. cum.wtr: $ 7,823
23:00 06:00 7:00 DRLG9736' - 9810' (74', 10.6 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 31,389

cum.Bits: $ 27,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM i 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40

MbbblVED IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

SEP192000

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 195 K# LITH: 40% SH, 60% SS BKG GAS 60
S/O 185 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 140
ROT. 190 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 140
FUEL Used: 619 On Hand: 2436 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP

GASCO GASCO ENERGY og ,
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT ;-o p- 3C ygg

AFE # 40118 GS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/19/2006 11
Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 9810' Prog: 74 D Hrs: 7 AV ROP: 10.6 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $488 TMC: $46,805 TDC: $10,498 CWC: $945,751
Contractt-r: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLECOST
Mw: 9.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt #: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 40 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. cag: $ - oayRate: $ 5,785
Gel: 15/35/46 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: 13.5 GPM : 381 SIN: 7106158 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 8 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 485' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 2/10 ECD: 9.7 Hrs: 42 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 11.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 46-300 wos: 8-14 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 700
Dapp ppb: 5.2 Btm.Up: 42 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 189.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 488
06:00 12:00 6:00 DOWN TIAE, WAITON NEW TORQUE COP VERTER Misc.l Labor: $ -

12:00 19:30 7:30 REPLACE TORQUE CONVERTER ON #2 DW MOTOR csg.crew: $ -

19:30 21:30 2:00 TIH Daily Total: $ 10,498
21:30 23:00 1:30 WASH AND REAM 90' TO BTM. cum.wtr: $ 7,823
23:00 06:00 7:00 DRLG9736' - 9810' (74', 10.6 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 31,389

cum.Bits: $ 27,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM i 33.01
IBS 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40

MbbblVED IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

SEP192000

TOTAL BHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 195 K# LITH: 40% SH, 60% SS BKG GAS 60
S/O 185 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 140
ROT. 190 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 140
FUEL Used: 619 On Hand: 2436 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP



GASCO ENERGYGASCO
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT ¿ g gy, ty

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/20/2006 12

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 10156' Prog: 346 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 14.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,937 TMC: $49,742 TDC: $31,840 CWC: $978,130
Contractor: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 9.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt s: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785
Gel: 15/35/46 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11.2 GPM: 381 SIN: 7106158 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 1,333
Solids: 10 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 13,140

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 831' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1.1/6.6 ECD: 10.3 Hrs: 65.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 12.7 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 45-250 wos: 23-25 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350

Dapp ppb: 6 Stm.Up: 42 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre k Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 212.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,937

06:00 17:30 11:30 DRLG9810' - 9997' (187', 16.3 FI H). Misc. I Labor: $ 2,770
17:30 18:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMSANDHCR. cag.crew: $ -

18:00 06:00 12:00 DRLG9997' - 10156' (159', 13.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 31,840
cum.wtr: $ 9,156
cum.Fuei $ 44,529
Cum. Bits: $ 27,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBs 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 205 K# LITH: 30% SH, 70% SS, COALSTRINGERS BKG GAS 1200

SIO 195 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 1450
ROT. 200 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 1760

FUEL Used: 987 On Hand: 5949 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP

GASCO ENERGYGASCO
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT ¿ g gy, ty

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/20/2006 12

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 10156' Prog: 346 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 14.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,937 TMC: $49,742 TDC: $31,840 CWC: $978,130
Contractor: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 9.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt s: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785
Gel: 15/35/46 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11.2 GPM: 381 SIN: 7106158 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1750 Jets: 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 1,333
Solids: 10 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 13,140

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 831' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1.1/6.6 ECD: 10.3 Hrs: 65.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 12.7 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 45-250 wos: 23-25 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350

Dapp ppb: 6 Stm.Up: 42 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre k Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 212.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,937

06:00 17:30 11:30 DRLG9810' - 9997' (187', 16.3 FI H). Misc. I Labor: $ 2,770
17:30 18:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMSANDHCR. cag.crew: $ -

18:00 06:00 12:00 DRLG9997' - 10156' (159', 13.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 31,840
cum.wtr: $ 9,156
cum.Fuei $ 44,529
Cum. Bits: $ 27,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBs 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 205 K# LITH: 30% SH, 70% SS, COALSTRINGERS BKG GAS 1200

SIO 195 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 1450
ROT. 200 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 1760

FUEL Used: 987 On Hand: 5949 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT yapp p

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471 W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/21/2006 13

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 10349' Prog: 193 D Hrs: 22 1/2 AV ROP: 8.6 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $1,502 TMC: $51,245 TDC: $14,512 CWC: $993,458
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.8 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit s: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785

Gel: 15/35/46 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12.2 GPM: 381 SIN: 7106158 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ 1,353

cake: 1 Press: 1650 Jets: 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 9 AV DC: 200 TD Out: 10349 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 1024' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1/5.4 ECD: 10.3 Hrs: 8Û Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR#1: FPH: 11.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 52-350 wos: 23-25 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,250
Dapp ppb: 5.4 Btm.Up: 48 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 235.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,502

06:00 8:00 2:00 DRLG 10156' - 10188' (32', 16.0 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ 97
8:00 8:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMSANDHCR. cag.crew: $ -

8:30 03:30 19:00 DRLG 10188' - 10349' (166', 8.5 FPH). Daily Total: $ 14,512

03:30 04:30 1:00 MIXEDANDPUMPED PILL,DROPPED SURVEY cum.wtr: $ 9,156
04:30 06:00 1:30 POOH FOR BIT#4 cum.Fuel $ 44,529

cum.sits: $ 27,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS i 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 210 K# LITH: 30% SH, 70% SS, COAL STRINGERS BKG GAS 300
S/O 200 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 505

ROT. 205 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 1950
FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 5949 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT yapp p

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471 W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/21/2006 13

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 10349' Prog: 193 D Hrs: 22 1/2 AV ROP: 8.6 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $1,502 TMC: $51,245 TDC: $14,512 CWC: $993,458
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.8 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit s: 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785

Gel: 15/35/46 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12.2 GPM: 381 SIN: 7106158 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ 1,353

cake: 1 Press: 1650 Jets: 6-17 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 9 AV DC: 200 TD Out: 10349 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 9325 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 1024' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1/5.4 ECD: 10.3 Hrs: 8Û Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR#1: FPH: 11.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 52-350 wos: 23-25 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,250
Dapp ppb: 5.4 Btm.Up: 48 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 235.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,502

06:00 8:00 2:00 DRLG 10156' - 10188' (32', 16.0 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ 97
8:00 8:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMSANDHCR. cag.crew: $ -

8:30 03:30 19:00 DRLG 10188' - 10349' (166', 8.5 FPH). Daily Total: $ 14,512

03:30 04:30 1:00 MIXEDANDPUMPED PILL,DROPPED SURVEY cum.wtr: $ 9,156
04:30 06:00 1:30 POOH FOR BIT#4 cum.Fuel $ 44,529

cum.sits: $ 27,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.01
IBS i 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.18
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 210 K# LITH: 30% SH, 70% SS, COAL STRINGERS BKG GAS 300
S/O 200 K# FLARE: CONN GAS 505

ROT. 205 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 1950
FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 5949 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP



GASCO GASCO ENERGY y'oss e/¢s s
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT L- 3,f - SË ŸÄ

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/22/2006 14

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 10443' Prog: 94 D Hrs: 6 1/2 AV ROP: 14.5 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $1,654 TMC: $52,900 TDC: $12,527 CWC: $991,473
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLGFLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 9,8 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit s: 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785
Gel: 14/34/43 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11 GPM : 381 SIN: 7205050 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 816
Cake: 1 Press: 1650 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 9 AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 10349 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 94' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1.1/5.5 ECD: 10.3 Hrs: 6.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 14.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 52-350 wos: 23-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 650
Dapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 48 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 241.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,654

06:00 11:00 5:00 FINISH POOH FOR BIT #4 Misc.ILabor: $ 97

11:00 13:30 2:30 C.O. BIT& MM. CHECKWEARBUSHINGOK. cag.crew: $ -

13:30 15:00 1:30 TIH Daily Total: $ 12,527

15:00 16:00 1:00 PU 10 JTS. HARDBANDDP cum.Wtr: $ 9,156
16:00 17:00 1:00 LD 10 JTS. DP Cum. Fuel $ 44,529

17:00 22:00 5:00 FINISHTIH cum.Bits: $ 27,000

22:00 23:30 1:30 WASH AND REAM90' TO BTM. BHA

23:30 06:00 6:30 DRLG 10349' - 10443' (32', 16.0 FPH). BIT i 1.00
0.13 MM i 33.03
iss 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.20
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 210 K# LITH: 60% SH, 30% SS, COAL STRINGERS BKG GAS 170

SIO 200 K# FLARE: 10' ON TRIP CONN GAS 1200

ROT. 205 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 3800
FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 5949 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS 4500

RECEivE
SEP2 5 2006

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&

GASCO GASCO ENERGY y'oss e/¢s s
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT L- 3,f - SË ŸÄ

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/22/2006 14

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 10443' Prog: 94 D Hrs: 6 1/2 AV ROP: 14.5 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $1,654 TMC: $52,900 TDC: $12,527 CWC: $991,473
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLGFLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 9,8 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit s: 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785
Gel: 14/34/43 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11 GPM : 381 SIN: 7205050 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 816
Cake: 1 Press: 1650 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 9 AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 10349 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 94' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1.1/5.5 ECD: 10.3 Hrs: 6.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 14.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 52-350 wos: 23-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 650
Dapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 48 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 241.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,654

06:00 11:00 5:00 FINISH POOH FOR BIT #4 Misc.ILabor: $ 97

11:00 13:30 2:30 C.O. BIT& MM. CHECKWEARBUSHINGOK. cag.crew: $ -

13:30 15:00 1:30 TIH Daily Total: $ 12,527

15:00 16:00 1:00 PU 10 JTS. HARDBANDDP cum.Wtr: $ 9,156
16:00 17:00 1:00 LD 10 JTS. DP Cum. Fuel $ 44,529

17:00 22:00 5:00 FINISHTIH cum.Bits: $ 27,000

22:00 23:30 1:30 WASH AND REAM90' TO BTM. BHA

23:30 06:00 6:30 DRLG 10349' - 10443' (32', 16.0 FPH). BIT i 1.00
0.13 MM i 33.03
iss 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.20
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 210 K# LITH: 60% SH, 30% SS, COAL STRINGERS BKG GAS 170

SIO 200 K# FLARE: 10' ON TRIP CONN GAS 1200

ROT. 205 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 3800
FUEL Used: 0 On Hand: 5949 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS 4500

RECEivE
SEP2 5 2006

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&



AGSCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT t/J-ov2- 3Cia7ÿ

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/23/2006 15

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 11115' Prog: 672 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 28.6 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $1,654 TMC: $52,900 TDC: $13,314 CWC: $1,019,298
Contractt r: Mud Co: M-I DRLO FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.9 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 42 sPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surr.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785

Gel: 14/34/43 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11 GPM: 381 SIN: 7205050 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1860 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 9 AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 10349 Packers: $ - Mud Logger $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 766' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1/6 ECD: 10.3 Hrs: 30 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 25.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 sPR #2 : 45-350 wos: 23-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 5 stm.up: 48 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 265.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,654

06:00 18:00 12:00 DRLG 10 43' - 10868' (425', 35.4 FPH). Misc. I Labor $ -

18:00 18:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag.Crew: $ -

18:30 06:00 11:30 DRLG 10868' - 11115' (247', 21.5 FPH). Daily Total: $ 13,314
cum.wtr: $ 9,156
Cum. Fuel $ 44,529
Cum. Bits: $ 27,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.03
IBs 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.20
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 225 K# LITH: 50% SH, 50% SS, TR SLTST, TR CALC,COALSTRING BKG GAS 1000

S/O 205 K# FLARE: 1-5' CONN GAS 980

ROT. 215 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS N/A

FUEL Used: 3269 On Hand: 2680 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

AGSCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT t/J-ov2- 3Cia7ÿ

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/23/2006 15

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 11115' Prog: 672 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 28.6 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $1,654 TMC: $52,900 TDC: $13,314 CWC: $1,019,298
Contractt r: Mud Co: M-I DRLO FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 9.9 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 42 sPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" surr.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 14/25 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785

Gel: 14/34/43 SPM: MFG: HTC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11 GPM: 381 SIN: 7205050 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1860 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 9 AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 10349 Packers: $ - Mud Logger $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 766' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1/6 ECD: 10.3 Hrs: 30 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 25.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 sPR #2 : 45-350 wos: 23-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 5 stm.up: 48 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 265.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,654

06:00 18:00 12:00 DRLG 10 43' - 10868' (425', 35.4 FPH). Misc. I Labor $ -

18:00 18:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag.Crew: $ -

18:30 06:00 11:30 DRLG 10868' - 11115' (247', 21.5 FPH). Daily Total: $ 13,314
cum.wtr: $ 9,156
Cum. Fuel $ 44,529
Cum. Bits: $ 27,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.03
IBs 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.20
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 225 K# LITH: 50% SH, 50% SS, TR SLTST, TR CALC,COALSTRING BKG GAS 1000

S/O 205 K# FLARE: 1-5' CONN GAS 980

ROT. 215 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS N/A

FUEL Used: 3269 On Hand: 2680 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



GASCO G^SCO ENERGY 765 MS 6

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT y pyyp-- 30/Ÿ

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/24/2006 16

Current Operations: WASH AND REAM TO BTM.
Depth: 11165' Prog: 50 D Hrs: 7 1/2 AV ROP: 6.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $3,170 TMC: $56,689 TDC: $34,238 CWC: $1,049,222
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRLA FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit s: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 41 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 13/21 #2 F-1000 3.5 ggm Type: HC506Z 509 int. cag: $ - Day nate: $ 5,785
Gel: 14/34/43 SPM: MFG: HTC STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: 11.2 GPM: 381 SIN: 7205050 JW8725 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1860 Jets: 6-16 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 13 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: 11165 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 12,008

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 10349 11165 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 816' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .85/5.5 ECD: 10.6 Hrs: 30 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 27.2 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 45-350 wos: 23-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 750

Dapp ppb: 5 stm.up: 52 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 265.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,170
06:00 13:30 7:30 DRLG 11115' - 11165' (50', 6.75 UPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

13:30 15:00 1:30 MIXANDPUMP PILL, DROPPED SURVEY cag.crew: $ -

15:00 21:00 6:00 POOH FOR BIT#5 Daily Total: $ 34,238
21:00 22:00 1:00 CHANGEOUT BIT, PULL AND CHECKWEARBUSHING,OK cum.wtr· $ 9,156
22:00 04:00 6:00 TIH Cum. Fuel $ 56,537

04:00 6:00 2:00 WASH AND REAM90' TO BTM. cum.Bits: $ 45,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.03
IBS 1 6.83
oc 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.20
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 227 K# LITH: 50% SH, 50% SS, TR SLTST, TR CALC,COALSTRING BKG GAS 1100

SlO 205 K# FLARE: 10-15' ON TRIP GAS CONN GAS 1580
ROT. 215 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 3520' KB PEAK GAS 1640

FUEL Used: 875 On Hand: 8736 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

GASCO G^SCO ENERGY 765 MS 6

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT y pyyp-- 30/Ÿ

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/24/2006 16

Current Operations: WASH AND REAM TO BTM.
Depth: 11165' Prog: 50 D Hrs: 7 1/2 AV ROP: 6.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $3,170 TMC: $56,689 TDC: $34,238 CWC: $1,049,222
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRLA FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit s: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: 41 SPM: 115 size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 13/21 #2 F-1000 3.5 ggm Type: HC506Z 509 int. cag: $ - Day nate: $ 5,785
Gel: 14/34/43 SPM: MFG: HTC STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: 11.2 GPM: 381 SIN: 7205050 JW8725 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1860 Jets: 6-16 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 13 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: 11165 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 12,008

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 10349 11165 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 816' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .85/5.5 ECD: 10.6 Hrs: 30 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 27.2 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000

ca : 100 SPR #2 : 45-350 wos: 23-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 750

Dapp ppb: 5 stm.up: 52 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 27.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 265.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,170
06:00 13:30 7:30 DRLG 11115' - 11165' (50', 6.75 UPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

13:30 15:00 1:30 MIXANDPUMP PILL, DROPPED SURVEY cag.crew: $ -

15:00 21:00 6:00 POOH FOR BIT#5 Daily Total: $ 34,238
21:00 22:00 1:00 CHANGEOUT BIT, PULL AND CHECKWEARBUSHING,OK cum.wtr· $ 9,156
22:00 04:00 6:00 TIH Cum. Fuel $ 56,537

04:00 6:00 2:00 WASH AND REAM90' TO BTM. cum.Bits: $ 45,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.03
IBS 1 6.83
oc 1 30.40
IBS 1 6.53
DC 17 523.41

TOTALBHA = 601.20
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 227 K# LITH: 50% SH, 50% SS, TR SLTST, TR CALC,COALSTRING BKG GAS 1100

SlO 205 K# FLARE: 10-15' ON TRIP GAS CONN GAS 1580
ROT. 215 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 3520' KB PEAK GAS 1640

FUEL Used: 875 On Hand: 8736 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



CONFlDENTIAL
GASCO GASCO ENERGY pg gigg yr

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT ypgf- 3£¾//
AFE #40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/25/2006 17

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 11411' Prog: 246 D Hrs: 19 1/2 AV ROP: 12.6 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $820 TMC: $57,509 TDC: $12,080 CWC: $1,074,615
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-IDRLM FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.2 si F-iooo a.sgpm Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 41 sPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 13/21 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MK705 Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785
Gel: 14/34/43 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: 12 GPM : 381 SIN: JW8725 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1980 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11165 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 246' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: 1/6.2 ECD: 10.6 Hrs: 19.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 12.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 sPas2: 45-350 wos: 30-35 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,950
Dapp ppb: 5.2 Btm.Up: 52 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro k Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
31.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 284.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 820

06:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG 11135' - 11234' (69', 10.6 EPH). Misc. I Labor $ -

12:30 13:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

13:00 15:00 2:00 DRLG 11234' - 11260' (26', 13.0 FPH). Daily Total: $ 12,080

15:00 19:00 4:00 REPAIR#1 AND#2 MUDPUMPS cum.wtr: $ 9,156
19:00 06:00 11:00 DRLG 11260' - 11411' (151', 13.7 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 56,537

cum.Bits: $ 45,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM 1 33.03
IBs 1 6.83
DC 1 30.40
DC 17 523.41

TOTAL BHA = 594.67
Survey 3° 7056'
Survey 2° 9310'

PIU 228 K# LITH: 70% SH, 20% SS BKG GAS 1100

SIO 209 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 1060
ROT. 220 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 1460
FUEL Used: 3450 On Hand: 5286 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP2 5 2M -

.

DWOFOIL,GAS&



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT I-/s o -3b

7//
AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-8-18 13,036 12,924 9/26/2006 18

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 11790' Prog: 379 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AVROP: 16.1 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $1,690 TMC: $59,200 TDC: $13,350 CWC: $1,075,885
Contract« r: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.2 es F-looo a.sgpm mts: 5 conductor $ -
Loc,Cost• $ -

vis: 40 SPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 13/21 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: MK705 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785

Gel: 14/34/45 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Pros cag: $ - nontalTools: $ 1,775

WL: 11 GPM : 381 SIN: JW8725 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cahe: 1 Psees: 2060 Jets 6-16 Wen Head- $ - Walen $ -

Sonds: 12 AV DC: 200 TD Out TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth in: 11165 Packers: $ - Mud Loggen $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 625' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .85/6.2 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 43 Separator $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor. 13000 SPR 91 : FPH: 14.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 sPR *2 : 45-350 wos: 30-35 Pumping LIT• $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350

Dapp ppb: 5.6 Stm.Up: 53 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ok Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ -
Consultant- $ 900

31.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 308.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,690

06:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG 11< 11' - 11521' (110', 16.9 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

12:30 13:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

13:00 06:00 17:00 DRLG 11521' - 11790' (269', 15.8 FPH). Daily Total: $ 13,350
cum.wtr $ 9,156
Cum. Fuel $ 56,537
cum.Bits: $ 45,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM i 33.03
IBs 1 6.83

RECEIVFD DC 1 30.40
DC 17 523.41

SEP2b 2006

DIV.OFÒlL,GAS&MINING
TOTAL BHA = 594.67
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIB 235 K# LITH: 95% SH, 5% COAL BKG GAS 1683

S/O 215 KS FLARE 10' CONit GAS 1316

ROT. 225 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 3520' KB PEAK GAS 2550

FUEL Used: 1195 On Hand: 4091 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT I-/s o -3b

7//
AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-8-18 13,036 12,924 9/26/2006 18

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 11790' Prog: 379 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AVROP: 16.1 Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $1,690 TMC: $59,200 TDC: $13,350 CWC: $1,075,885
Contract« r: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.2 es F-looo a.sgpm mts: 5 conductor $ -
Loc,Cost• $ -

vis: 40 SPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 13/21 #2 F-1000 3.5 ppm Type: MK705 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 5,785

Gel: 14/34/45 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Pros cag: $ - nontalTools: $ 1,775

WL: 11 GPM : 381 SIN: JW8725 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cahe: 1 Psees: 2060 Jets 6-16 Wen Head- $ - Walen $ -

Sonds: 12 AV DC: 200 TD Out TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth in: 11165 Packers: $ - Mud Loggen $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 625' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .85/6.2 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 43 Separator $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor. 13000 SPR 91 : FPH: 14.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 100 sPR *2 : 45-350 wos: 30-35 Pumping LIT• $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350

Dapp ppb: 5.6 Stm.Up: 53 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ok Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 Misc: $ -
Consultant- $ 900

31.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 308.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,690

06:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG 11< 11' - 11521' (110', 16.9 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

12:30 13:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR. cag.crew: $ -

13:00 06:00 17:00 DRLG 11521' - 11790' (269', 15.8 FPH). Daily Total: $ 13,350
cum.wtr $ 9,156
Cum. Fuel $ 56,537
cum.Bits: $ 45,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
0.13 MM i 33.03
IBs 1 6.83

RECEIVFD DC 1 30.40
DC 17 523.41

SEP2b 2006

DIV.OFÒlL,GAS&MINING
TOTAL BHA = 594.67
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIB 235 K# LITH: 95% SH, 5% COAL BKG GAS 1683

S/O 215 KS FLARE 10' CONit GAS 1316

ROT. 225 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 3520' KB PEAK GAS 2550

FUEL Used: 1195 On Hand: 4091 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP



GAS00 GASCO ENERGY
Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT

s if4'o 4 so.oie'
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/27/2006 19

Current Operations: REPAIR MUDPUMPS
Depth: 11805' Prog: 394 jD Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 16.8 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,155 TMC: $61,355 TDC: $25,059 CWC: $1,157,836
Contractor: Mud Co: M-!DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGlBLECOST

Mw: 10.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 pm Bit s: 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost $ -

vis: 46 sPu: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $
PviYP: 13/21 #2 F-1000 3.5 pm T pe: MK705 Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 14,875

Gel: 14/34/45 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 1Û.8 GPM: 381 SIN: JWB725 FloatEqup: $ - Truckin : $ 540
Cake: 1 Press: 2060 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 1,614

SoNds: 15 Av oc: 200 To out: 11805 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11165 Packers: $ - Mud Logger· $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 640' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: .6/5.8 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 47.5 separator: $ - coment: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 13.5 Heater: $ - sits: $ -

ca : 100 sPRs2: 45-350 wos: 30-35 Pumpin LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 5.4 Stm.Up: 54 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $
Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 mae: $ - consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 37.5 Total Rot. Hra: 312.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $
06:00 10:30 4:30 DRLG 11790' - 11805 Misc. I Labor: $
10:30 11:00 0:30 MIXEDAND PUMPED PILL cag.crew: $
11:00 13:30 2:30 POOH FOR BIT#6 Daily Total: $ 25,059

13:30 19:00 5:30 REPAIR DRAWWORKS cum.wtr $ 10,770
19:00 23:00 4:00 POOH FOR BIT #6 cum. Fuei $ 56,537
23:00 00:30 1:30 CHANGEOUT BHA cum.Bits: $ 45,000

00:30 3:30 3:00 TlH TO 3450' BHA

3:30 5:30 2:00 SLIP ANDCUT DRLG LINE BIT

5:30 6:00 0:30 REPAIR MUDPUMPS 0.13 MM 1 33.03

Dc 1 30.40
DC 17 523.41

TOTALSHA = 594.
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

P/U 225 K# LITH: 95% SH, S% COAL BKG GAS
S/O 215 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 1316

ROT. 225 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 GIS" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 2550

FUEL Used: 909 On Hand: 3182 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP2 7 2006

DMOF01L,GAS&

GAS00 GASCO ENERGY
Energy DAILY DRILLING REPORT

s if4'o 4 so.oie'
Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/27/2006 19

Current Operations: REPAIR MUDPUMPS
Depth: 11805' Prog: 394 jD Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 16.8 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,155 TMC: $61,355 TDC: $25,059 CWC: $1,157,836
Contractor: Mud Co: M-!DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGlBLECOST

Mw: 10.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 pm Bit s: 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost $ -

vis: 46 sPu: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $
PviYP: 13/21 #2 F-1000 3.5 pm T pe: MK705 Int. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 14,875

Gel: 14/34/45 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 1Û.8 GPM: 381 SIN: JWB725 FloatEqup: $ - Truckin : $ 540
Cake: 1 Press: 2060 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 1,614

SoNds: 15 Av oc: 200 To out: 11805 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11165 Packers: $ - Mud Logger· $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 640' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Pf/Mf: .6/5.8 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 47.5 separator: $ - coment: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 13.5 Heater: $ - sits: $ -

ca : 100 sPRs2: 45-350 wos: 30-35 Pumpin LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 5.4 Stm.Up: 54 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $
Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 50 mae: $ - consultant: $ 900

START END TIME 37.5 Total Rot. Hra: 312.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $
06:00 10:30 4:30 DRLG 11790' - 11805 Misc. I Labor: $
10:30 11:00 0:30 MIXEDAND PUMPED PILL cag.crew: $
11:00 13:30 2:30 POOH FOR BIT#6 Daily Total: $ 25,059

13:30 19:00 5:30 REPAIR DRAWWORKS cum.wtr $ 10,770
19:00 23:00 4:00 POOH FOR BIT #6 cum. Fuei $ 56,537
23:00 00:30 1:30 CHANGEOUT BHA cum.Bits: $ 45,000

00:30 3:30 3:00 TlH TO 3450' BHA

3:30 5:30 2:00 SLIP ANDCUT DRLG LINE BIT

5:30 6:00 0:30 REPAIR MUDPUMPS 0.13 MM 1 33.03

Dc 1 30.40
DC 17 523.41

TOTALSHA = 594.
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

P/U 225 K# LITH: 95% SH, S% COAL BKG GAS
S/O 215 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 1316

ROT. 225 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 GIS" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 2550

FUEL Used: 909 On Hand: 3182 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
SEP2 7 2006

DMOF01L,GAS&



llEGL
GASCO GASCO ENERGY you gggry
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT p-off-3bh?

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/28/2006 20

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 11858' Prog: 53 |D Hrs: 14 1/2 AV ROP: 3.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,143 TMC: $63,499 TDC: $24,587 CWC: $1,230,744
Contractor: Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt #: 6 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 45 SPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 19/22 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MK705 Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 14,875

Gel: 14/24/40 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

wt: 10.8 GPM : 381 SIN: JW8048 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 540

Cake: 1 Press: 2085 Jets: TFA1.5 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 1,614

Solids: 13 Av oc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11805 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 53' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PffMf: .9/8.5 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 14.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 6000 SPR #1 : FPH: 3.7 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 45-350 wos: 15-22 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,450

Dapp ppb: 5.2 stm.up: 54 R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 381 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 37.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 327.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,143
06:00 8:30 2:30 REPAIR #1 MUD PUMP Misc. I Labor: $ 440

8:30 13:00 4:30 TIH w/ BIT #6 cap.crew: $ -

13:00 15:00 2:00 WASH AND REAM 90' TO BTM. Daily Total: $ 24,587
15:00 15:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMSAND HCR, REPAIR EPEC. cum.wtr: $ 10,770
15:30 06:00 14:30 DRLG 11805' - 11858' (53', 3.7 FPH). Cum. Fuei $ 56,537

cum.sits: $ 45,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
#1 MM NOT USABLE, WASHED OUT SEAT 1.0 MM 1 33.11

IBs 1 6.83
DC 18 553.81

9 ICEIVED

SEP2 8 2006

DIVOFOlL,GAS&MINING TOTALBHA = 594.75
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 238 K# LITH: 95% SH, 5% LIME MUDSTONE BKG GAS 1030

SIO 215 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 1030

ROT. 229 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 1030

FUEL Used: 867 On Hand: 2315 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

llEGL
GASCO GASCO ENERGY you gggry
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT p-off-3bh?

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/28/2006 20

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 11858' Prog: 53 |D Hrs: 14 1/2 AV ROP: 3.7 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $2,143 TMC: $63,499 TDC: $24,587 CWC: $1,230,744
Contractor: Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm BIt #: 6 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 45 SPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 19/22 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MK705 Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 14,875

Gel: 14/24/40 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

wt: 10.8 GPM : 381 SIN: JW8048 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 540

Cake: 1 Press: 2085 Jets: TFA1.5 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 1,614

Solids: 13 Av oc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11805 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 53' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PffMf: .9/8.5 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 14.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 6000 SPR #1 : FPH: 3.7 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 45-350 wos: 15-22 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,450

Dapp ppb: 5.2 stm.up: 54 R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 381 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 37.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 327.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,143
06:00 8:30 2:30 REPAIR #1 MUD PUMP Misc. I Labor: $ 440

8:30 13:00 4:30 TIH w/ BIT #6 cap.crew: $ -

13:00 15:00 2:00 WASH AND REAM 90' TO BTM. Daily Total: $ 24,587
15:00 15:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMSAND HCR, REPAIR EPEC. cum.wtr: $ 10,770
15:30 06:00 14:30 DRLG 11805' - 11858' (53', 3.7 FPH). Cum. Fuei $ 56,537

cum.sits: $ 45,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
#1 MM NOT USABLE, WASHED OUT SEAT 1.0 MM 1 33.11

IBs 1 6.83
DC 18 553.81

9 ICEIVED

SEP2 8 2006

DIVOFOlL,GAS&MINING TOTALBHA = 594.75
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 238 K# LITH: 95% SH, 5% LIME MUDSTONE BKG GAS 1030

SIO 215 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 1030

ROT. 229 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 1030

FUEL Used: 867 On Hand: 2315 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



CUNFilENTIAL
GASCO GASCO ENERGY . -cy

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT Lgg
AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/29/2006 21

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 11956' Prog: 98 D Hrs: 22 AV ROP: 4.5 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $1,666 TMC: $65,165 TDC: $38,804 CWC: $1,272,440
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.5 si F-1ooo a.sgpm Bit #: 6 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 39 SPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 12/16 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MK705 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593
Gel: 11/23/37 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 14 GPM : 381 SIN: JW8048 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 812
Cake: 1 Press: 2085 Jets: TFA1.5 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 11 AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 12,008
Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11805 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 151' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .6/7.8 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 36.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 4.1 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 140 SPR #2 : 45-350 wos: 15-22 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,200
Dapp ppb: 5.1 Btm.Up: 54 R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 381 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 349.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,666

06:00 9:30 3:30 DRLG 11f 58' - 11870' (12', 3.6 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

9:30 10:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSANDHCR, REPAIR EPEC. cag.crew: $ -

10:00 00:30 14:30 DRLG 11870' - 11931' (61', 4.2 FPH). Daily Total: $ 38,804
00:30 2:00 1:30 REPAIR DRAWWORKSCHAIN cum.wtr: $ 10,770
2:00 06:00 4:00 DRLG 11931' - 11956' (25', 6.3 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 68,545

cum.sits: $ 45,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
1.0 MM 1 33.11
IBS 1 6.83
DC 18 553.81

RECElVED
SEP2Ë2006

DIY.0Fgj nau MINING TOTAL BHA= 594.75
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 239 K# LITH: 5% SH, 95% SS BKG GAS 2000
S/O 220 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 2500
ROT. 228 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 2600
FUEL Used: 1131 On Hand: 5684 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

CUNFilENTIAL
GASCO GASCO ENERGY . -cy

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT Lgg
AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/29/2006 21

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 11956' Prog: 98 D Hrs: 22 AV ROP: 4.5 Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $1,666 TMC: $65,165 TDC: $38,804 CWC: $1,272,440
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.5 si F-1ooo a.sgpm Bit #: 6 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 39 SPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 12/16 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: MK705 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593
Gel: 11/23/37 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 14 GPM : 381 SIN: JW8048 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 812
Cake: 1 Press: 2085 Jets: TFA1.5 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 11 AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 12,008
Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11805 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 151' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .6/7.8 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 36.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 4.1 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 140 SPR #2 : 45-350 wos: 15-22 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,200
Dapp ppb: 5.1 Btm.Up: 54 R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 381 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 349.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,666

06:00 9:30 3:30 DRLG 11f 58' - 11870' (12', 3.6 FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

9:30 10:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSANDHCR, REPAIR EPEC. cag.crew: $ -

10:00 00:30 14:30 DRLG 11870' - 11931' (61', 4.2 FPH). Daily Total: $ 38,804
00:30 2:00 1:30 REPAIR DRAWWORKSCHAIN cum.wtr: $ 10,770
2:00 06:00 4:00 DRLG 11931' - 11956' (25', 6.3 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 68,545

cum.sits: $ 45,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
1.0 MM 1 33.11
IBS 1 6.83
DC 18 553.81

RECElVED
SEP2Ë2006

DIY.0Fgj nau MINING TOTAL BHA= 594.75
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 239 K# LITH: 5% SH, 95% SS BKG GAS 2000
S/O 220 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 2500
ROT. 228 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 2600
FUEL Used: 1131 On Hand: 5684 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3 49

AFE # 40118 PS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/30/2006 22

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 12056' Prog: 99 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 4.2 Formation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $3,863 TMC: $69,028 TDC: $28,331 CWC: $1,300,772
Contractt r: Mud Co: M-I DRLO FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit s: 6 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 41 SPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 13/17 #2 F-1000 3.5 ggm Type: MK705 Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593

Gel: 11/27/41 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12.6 GPM : 381 SIN: JW8048 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 2125 Jets: TFA1.5 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 11 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11805 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 250' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .4/7 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 60 separator: $ - coment: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 4.2 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR#2: 52-500 wos: 15-22 Pumping LTT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 4.9 Btm.Up: 60 R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre k Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 381 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 372.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,863

06:00 08:30 2:30 DRLG 110 56' - 11966' (10', 4.0 F:*H). Misc. I Labor: $ -

08:30 09:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR cag.crew: $ -

09:00 06:00 21:00 DRLG 11966'- 12055' (89', 4.2 FPH). Daily Total: $ 28,331
cum.wtr· $ 10,770
Cum. Fuei $ 68,545
Cum. Bits: $ 45,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
1.0 MM 1 33.11
IBS 1 6.83

RECE1VI 3 DC 18 553.81

0CT0 Z2005

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
TOTAL BHA = 594.75

Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

P/U 240 K# LITH: 5% SH, 95% SS BKG GAS 2250

S/O 223 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 2850

ROT. 229 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 2850
FUEL Used: 1063 On Hand: 4621 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT 3 49

AFE # 40118 PS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 9/30/2006 22

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 12056' Prog: 99 D Hrs: 23 1/2 AV ROP: 4.2 Formation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $3,863 TMC: $69,028 TDC: $28,331 CWC: $1,300,772
Contractt r: Mud Co: M-I DRLO FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit s: 6 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 41 SPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 13/17 #2 F-1000 3.5 ggm Type: MK705 Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593

Gel: 11/27/41 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12.6 GPM : 381 SIN: JW8048 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 2125 Jets: TFA1.5 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 11 AV Dc: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11805 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 250' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .4/7 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 60 separator: $ - coment: $ -

Chlor: 13000 SPR #1 : FPH: 4.2 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR#2: 52-500 wos: 15-22 Pumping LTT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,350
Dapp ppb: 4.9 Btm.Up: 60 R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre k Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 381 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 372.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,863

06:00 08:30 2:30 DRLG 110 56' - 11966' (10', 4.0 F:*H). Misc. I Labor: $ -

08:30 09:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMSAND HCR cag.crew: $ -

09:00 06:00 21:00 DRLG 11966'- 12055' (89', 4.2 FPH). Daily Total: $ 28,331
cum.wtr· $ 10,770
Cum. Fuei $ 68,545
Cum. Bits: $ 45,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
1.0 MM 1 33.11
IBS 1 6.83

RECE1VI 3 DC 18 553.81

0CT0 Z2005

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
TOTAL BHA = 594.75

Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

P/U 240 K# LITH: 5% SH, 95% SS BKG GAS 2250

S/O 223 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 2850

ROT. 229 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 2850
FUEL Used: 1063 On Hand: 4621 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE #40118 GPS - N 40 . 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/1/2006 23

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 12138' Prog: 83 |D Hrs: 12 AV ROP: 6.9 Formation: BLACKHAWK
DMC: $2,801 TMC:

.

$71,829 TDC: $26,119 CWC: $1,326,891
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLO FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 6 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 45 SPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/23 #2 F-1000 3.5 ggm Type: MK705 Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593

Gel: 15/39/56 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12 GPM : 381 s/N: JW8048 Float Eclup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 2125 Jets: TFA1.5 Well Head: $ - Water $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 200 TD Out: 12138 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11805 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 333' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .5/8.6 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 72 separator: $ - coment: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 4.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 52-500 wos: 15-22 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,200

Dapp ppb: 5.6 Btm.Up: 60 R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 381 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 384.5 Daily Total: $ - DriHing Mud: $ 2,801

06:00 07:30 1:30 DRLG 120 55' - 12061' (6', 4.0 FP I). Misc. I Labor: $ -

07:30 08:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMS,ANNULAR, ANDHCR cag.crew: $ -

08:00 18:30 10:30 DRLG 12061'- 12138' (77', 7.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 26,119

18:30 19:30 1:00 MIXEDANDPUMPED PILL cum.wtr $ 10,770

19:30 02:00 6:30 POOH FOR BIT#7 Cum. Fuel $ 68,545

02:00 3:30 1:30 CHANGE OUT BHA cum.sits: $ 45,000

3:30 06:00 2:30 TIH INCOMPLETE BHA
BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.11
IBS 1 6.83
DC 18 553.81

RECEIVED
OCTn2 inns

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING TOTAL BHA = 594.75

Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

P/U 240 K# LITH: SH, SS BKG GAS 1900

SlO 225 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 1300

ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 2600

FUEL Used: 1566 On Hand: 3055 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT
AFE #40118 GPS - N 40 . 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/1/2006 23

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 12138' Prog: 83 |D Hrs: 12 AV ROP: 6.9 Formation: BLACKHAWK
DMC: $2,801 TMC:

.

$71,829 TDC: $26,119 CWC: $1,326,891
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLO FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: 6 RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 45 SPM: 0 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 18/23 #2 F-1000 3.5 ggm Type: MK705 Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593

Gel: 15/39/56 SPM: 115 MFG: STC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12 GPM : 381 s/N: JW8048 Float Eclup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 2 Press: 2125 Jets: TFA1.5 Well Head: $ - Water $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 200 TD Out: 12138 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 11805 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 333' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .5/8.6 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 72 separator: $ - coment: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 4.6 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 52-500 wos: 15-22 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,200

Dapp ppb: 5.6 Btm.Up: 60 R-RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 381 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 384.5 Daily Total: $ - DriHing Mud: $ 2,801

06:00 07:30 1:30 DRLG 120 55' - 12061' (6', 4.0 FP I). Misc. I Labor: $ -

07:30 08:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMS,ANNULAR, ANDHCR cag.crew: $ -

08:00 18:30 10:30 DRLG 12061'- 12138' (77', 7.3 FPH). Daily Total: $ 26,119

18:30 19:30 1:00 MIXEDANDPUMPED PILL cum.wtr $ 10,770

19:30 02:00 6:30 POOH FOR BIT#7 Cum. Fuel $ 68,545

02:00 3:30 1:30 CHANGE OUT BHA cum.sits: $ 45,000

3:30 06:00 2:30 TIH INCOMPLETE BHA
BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 33.11
IBS 1 6.83
DC 18 553.81

RECEIVED

OCTn2 inns

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING TOTAL BHA = 594.75

Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

P/U 240 K# LITH: SH, SS BKG GAS 1900

SlO 225 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 1300

ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 2600

FUEL Used: 1566 On Hand: 3055 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT yy ogg-.. 36 9 i

ne rgy AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/2/2006 24

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 12285' Prog: 147 D Hrs: 19 1/2 AV ROP: 7.5 Formation: SUNNY SIDE

DMC: $1,764 TMC: $73,593 TDC: $25,832 CWC: $1,352,724
Contract¢ r: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit s: 7 Conductor $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 110 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: VTD616 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593

Gel: 11/23/41 sPM: 0 MFG: VER Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12.8 GPM : 365 SIN: 3061 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 2080 Jets: 6-18 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuef: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 12138 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 147' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .5/7.8 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 19.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 7.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 53-530 wos: 15-32 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,950

Dapp ppb: 5.3 Stm.Up: 65 R-RPM: 45-55 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ok Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 47 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 404.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,764

06:00 9:00 3:00 TIH Misc. I Labor· $ -

9:00 10:00 1:00 WASH ANDREAM90' TO BTM cag.crew: $ -

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMS,ANDHCR Daily Total: $ 25,832

10:30 06:00 19:30 DRLG 12138' - 12285 (147', 7.5 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 10,770
Cum. Fuel $ 68,545
Cum. Bits: $ 45,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM i 32.96
IBS 1 6.83

REChlVED
oc is ssa.81

0C¡ O2 ¿ulm

M OEOlL,OÀb&MINING TOTAL BHA = 594.60

Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 1111T

PIU 245 K# LITH: 30% SH, 70% SS BKG GAS 2900

S/O 220 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 3100
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 3500

FUEL Used: 976 On Hand: 2079 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY

E DAILY DRILLING REPORT yy ogg-.. 36 9 i

ne rgy AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/2/2006 24

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 12285' Prog: 147 D Hrs: 19 1/2 AV ROP: 7.5 Formation: SUNNY SIDE

DMC: $1,764 TMC: $73,593 TDC: $25,832 CWC: $1,352,724
Contract¢ r: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit s: 7 Conductor $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 42 SPM: 110 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: VTD616 int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593

Gel: 11/23/41 sPM: 0 MFG: VER Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12.8 GPM : 365 SIN: 3061 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 2080 Jets: 6-18 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 200 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuef: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 298 Depth In: 12138 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 106 FTG: 147' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .5/7.8 ECD: 10.7 Hrs: 19.5 separator: $ - cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 7.5 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 53-530 wos: 15-32 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,950

Dapp ppb: 5.3 Stm.Up: 65 R-RPM: 45-55 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ok Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 47 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 404.0 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,764

06:00 9:00 3:00 TIH Misc. I Labor· $ -

9:00 10:00 1:00 WASH ANDREAM90' TO BTM cag.crew: $ -

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMS,ANDHCR Daily Total: $ 25,832

10:30 06:00 19:30 DRLG 12138' - 12285 (147', 7.5 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 10,770
Cum. Fuel $ 68,545
Cum. Bits: $ 45,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM i 32.96
IBS 1 6.83

REChlVED
oc is ssa.81

0C¡ O2 ¿ulm

M OEOlL,OÀb&MINING TOTAL BHA = 594.60

Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 1111T

PIU 245 K# LITH: 30% SH, 70% SS BKG GAS 2900

S/O 220 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 3100
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS 3500

FUEL Used: 976 On Hand: 2079 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



0AGSCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT y_ p...g gÿ

AFE # 40118 GP - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/3/2006 25

Current Operations: CHANGE OUT BIT
Depth: 12285' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 19 1/2 AV ROP: 0.0 Formation: SUNNYSIDE
DMC: $5,548 TMC: $79,141 TDC: $41,438 CWC: $1,403,162
Contractor: Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.6 si F-iooo s.s gpm sits: 7 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 47 SPM: 110 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 19/22 #2 F-1000 3.s gpm Type: VTD616 int. cag: $ - Day nate: $ 18,593

Gel: 15/36/49 SPM: 0 MFG: VER Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12 GPM : 365 SIN: 3061 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1950 Jets: 6-18 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solida: 12.8 AV DC: 289 To out: 12371 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 11,8Ž2
Sand: AV DP: 194 Depth In: 12138 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 82 FTG: 147' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .5/7.8 ECD: 11.1 Hrs: 37 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 4.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 53-530 wos: 15-32 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,950

Dapp ppb: 5.1 Btm.Up: 65 R-RPM: 45-65 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 47 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 421.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 5,548

06:00 11:30 5:30 DRLG 12 85' - 12317' (32', 5.87.£·FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

11:30 12:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMS,AND HCR cag. crew: $ -

12:00 00:00 12:00 DRLG 12317' - 12371' (54', 4.5 FPH). Daily Total: $ 41,438

00:00 06:00 6:00 TOOH FOR BIT #8 cum.wtr $ 10,770
Cum. Fuel $ 80,367
cum.sits: $ 54,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 32.96
IBS 1 6.83
DC 18 553.81

OCTO3 2006
nivnwnll R &MINING

TOTALBHA = 594.60
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 240 K# LITH: 25% SH, 75% SS BKG GAS 2600

S/O 225 K# FLARE: 5' CONN GAS 2800

ROT. 232 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 3300
FUEL Used: 1027 On Hand: 5552 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

0AGSCO GASCO ENERGY

Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT y_ p...g gÿ
AFE # 40118 GP - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/3/2006 25

Current Operations: CHANGE OUT BIT
Depth: 12285' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 19 1/2 AV ROP: 0.0 Formation: SUNNYSIDE
DMC: $5,548 TMC: $79,141 TDC: $41,438 CWC: $1,403,162
Contractor: Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.6 si F-iooo s.s gpm sits: 7 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 47 SPM: 110 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 19/22 #2 F-1000 3.s gpm Type: VTD616 int. cag: $ - Day nate: $ 18,593

Gel: 15/36/49 SPM: 0 MFG: VER Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12 GPM : 365 SIN: 3061 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 1950 Jets: 6-18 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solida: 12.8 AV DC: 289 To out: 12371 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 11,8Ž2
Sand: AV DP: 194 Depth In: 12138 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 82 FTG: 147' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .5/7.8 ECD: 11.1 Hrs: 37 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 4.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 53-530 wos: 15-32 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,950

Dapp ppb: 5.1 Btm.Up: 65 R-RPM: 45-65 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 47 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 421.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 5,548

06:00 11:30 5:30 DRLG 12 85' - 12317' (32', 5.87.£·FPH). Misc. I Labor: $ -

11:30 12:00 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD, PIPE RAMS,AND HCR cag. crew: $ -

12:00 00:00 12:00 DRLG 12317' - 12371' (54', 4.5 FPH). Daily Total: $ 41,438

00:00 06:00 6:00 TOOH FOR BIT #8 cum.wtr $ 10,770
Cum. Fuel $ 80,367
cum.sits: $ 54,000

BHA
BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 32.96
IBS 1 6.83
DC 18 553.81

OCTO3 2006
nivnwnll R &MINING

TOTALBHA = 594.60
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 240 K# LITH: 25% SH, 75% SS BKG GAS 2600

S/O 225 K# FLARE: 5' CONN GAS 2800

ROT. 232 K# LASTCSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS 3300
FUEL Used: 1027 On Hand: 5552 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

'¯†^0 6 A'/6/ s af
Energy AFE#40118 N4 90

.471'

W109°50.016'

We11: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/4/2006 26

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 12714' Prog: 343 D Hrs: 16 |AV ROP: 21.4 Formation: ABERDEEN

DMC: $1,950 TMC: $81,092 TDC: $43,484 CWC: $1,446,646
Contract¢ r: Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: Û Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 55 SPM: 110 Size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 23/27 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593

Gel: 16/37/54 SPM: 0 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12 GPM : 365 SIN: 7110988 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 718

Cake: 2 Press: 1950 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 5,322

Solids: 12.8 AV DC: 289 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 194 Depth In: 12371 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 82 FTG: 343' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.9 ECD: 11.1 Hrs: 16 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 21.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 43-490 wos: 10-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motom: $ 1,600

Dapp ppb: 5.3 atm.up: 68 R-RPM: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro ok Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 47 mee: $ - consultant: $ 900

41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 437.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $4,726

06:00 7:00 1:00 PULL ANI CHECK WEARBUSH NG, OK Misc.l Labor: $ -

7:00 8:30 1:30 TlH TO 3492' cag.crew: $ -

8:30 9:30 1:00 SLIP AND CUT DRLG LINE Daily Total: $ 43,484

9:30 13:00 3:30 FINISHTlH cum.wtr $ 16,092

13:00 14:00 1:00 WASH AND REAM90' TO BTM cum.Fuel $ 80,367

14:00 06:00 16:00 DRLG 12371 - 12714' (32', 5.87.5 FPH). cum.sits: $ 63,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 32.96
IBS 1 6.83

RECEIV oc 18 553.81

0CTO420

DIV.OEOlL,On
TOTAL BHA = 594.60

Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 250 K# LITH: 25% SH, 75% SS BKG GAS 2500

S/O 230 K# FLARE: 5' CONN GAS 3450

ROT. 240 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET Çd) 3520' KB PEAK GAS 5150

FUEL Used: 1196 On Hand: 4356 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

'¯†^0 6 A'/6/ s af
Energy AFE#40118 N4 90

.471'

W109°50.016'

We11: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/4/2006 26

Current Operations: DRILLING
Depth: 12714' Prog: 343 D Hrs: 16 |AV ROP: 21.4 Formation: ABERDEEN

DMC: $1,950 TMC: $81,092 TDC: $43,484 CWC: $1,446,646
Contract¢ r: Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: 10.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: Û Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 55 SPM: 110 Size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 23/27 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z Int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593

Gel: 16/37/54 SPM: 0 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 12 GPM : 365 SIN: 7110988 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 718

Cake: 2 Press: 1950 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 5,322

Solids: 12.8 AV DC: 289 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 194 Depth In: 12371 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 82 FTG: 343' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.9 ECD: 11.1 Hrs: 16 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 21.4 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,000

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 43-490 wos: 10-20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motom: $ 1,600

Dapp ppb: 5.3 atm.up: 68 R-RPM: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro ok Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 47 mee: $ - consultant: $ 900

41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 437.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $4,726

06:00 7:00 1:00 PULL ANI CHECK WEARBUSH NG, OK Misc.l Labor: $ -

7:00 8:30 1:30 TlH TO 3492' cag.crew: $ -

8:30 9:30 1:00 SLIP AND CUT DRLG LINE Daily Total: $ 43,484

9:30 13:00 3:30 FINISHTlH cum.wtr $ 16,092

13:00 14:00 1:00 WASH AND REAM90' TO BTM cum.Fuel $ 80,367

14:00 06:00 16:00 DRLG 12371 - 12714' (32', 5.87.5 FPH). cum.sits: $ 63,000
BHA

BIT 1 1.00
.13 MM 1 32.96
IBS 1 6.83

RECEIV oc 18 553.81

0CTO420

DIV.OEOlL,On
TOTAL BHA = 594.60

Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 250 K# LITH: 25% SH, 75% SS BKG GAS 2500

S/O 230 K# FLARE: 5' CONN GAS 3450

ROT. 240 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET Çd) 3520' KB PEAK GAS 5150

FUEL Used: 1196 On Hand: 4356 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLING REPORTEnergy AFE #40118 PS - N 40 00. 1 W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/5/2006 27

Current Operations: RUNNINGOPEN HOLE LOGS
Depth: 12940' Prog: 226 D Hrs: 12 AV ROP: 18.8 Formation: SPRING CANYON
DMC: $2,232 TMC: $83,325 TDC: $25,550 CWC: $1,472,197
Contractt-r: Mud Co: M-I DRLA FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit 8: 8 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 44 SPM: 110 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 17/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593

Gel: 13/32/47 SPM: 0 MFG: HTC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11.8 GPM: 365 SIN: 7110988 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 2100 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 289 To out: 12940 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 194 Depth In: 12371 Packers: $ - Mud Logger· $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 82 FTG: 569' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.9 ECD: 11.1 Hrs: 28 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 20.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 45-400 wos: 25 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,200

Dapp ppb: 5.3 Btm.Up: 68 R-RPM: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 47 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 449.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $Ž,232
06:00 10:00 4:00 DRLG 12714'- 12825' (111', 27.8 FPH). Misc.ILabor: $ -

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMS,ANNULAR,AND HCR cag.crew: $ -

10:30 18:30 8:00 DRLG 12825' - 12940' (115', 14.4 FPH). Daily Total: $ 25,550

18:30 20:30 2:00 CIRC. AND COND HOLE FOR LOGS cum.wtr· $ 16,092

20:30 02:00 5:30 POOH FOR OPEN HOLE LOGS Cum. Fuel $ 80,367
02:00 02:30 0:30 LAY DOWN BIT, MM,AND IBS cum.sits: $ 63,000
02:30 03:00 0:30 RIG UP PHOENIX SURVEYS BHA
03:00 06:00 3:00 RUNNINGOPEN HOLE LOGS, INCOMPLETE BIT 1 1.00

.13 MM 1 32.96
REACHED 12,940'TD AT 18:30, 10/4/06 IBs 1 6.83
RELEASED COLUMBINE LOGGINGAT 19:30, 10/4/06 DC 18 553.81

HEUt-IVED

OCTU $ AUUb
TOTAL BHA = 594.60

L Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 255 K# LITH: 25% SH, 75% SS BKG GAS 2600
SIO 240 K# FLARE: 105' CONN GAS 3050

ROT. 245 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 3520' KB PEAK GAS 5000
FUEL Used: 917 On Hand: 3439 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLING REPORTEnergy AFE #40118 PS - N 40 00. 1 W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/5/2006 27

Current Operations: RUNNINGOPEN HOLE LOGS
Depth: 12940' Prog: 226 D Hrs: 12 AV ROP: 18.8 Formation: SPRING CANYON
DMC: $2,232 TMC: $83,325 TDC: $25,550 CWC: $1,472,197
Contractt-r: Mud Co: M-I DRLA FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit 8: 8 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

vis: 44 SPM: 110 size: 7-7/8" surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 17/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: HC506Z int. cag: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593

Gel: 13/32/47 SPM: 0 MFG: HTC Prod Cag: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11.8 GPM: 365 SIN: 7110988 FloatEqup: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: 1 Press: 2100 Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 289 To out: 12940 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 194 Depth In: 12371 Packers: $ - Mud Logger· $ 850

PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 82 FTG: 569' Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.9 ECD: 11.1 Hrs: 28 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: 20.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 45-400 wos: 25 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,200

Dapp ppb: 5.3 Btm.Up: 68 R-RPM: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bro ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: 47 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 449.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $Ž,232
06:00 10:00 4:00 DRLG 12714'- 12825' (111', 27.8 FPH). Misc.ILabor: $ -

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SER, TEST HYD,PIPE RAMS,ANNULAR,AND HCR cag.crew: $ -

10:30 18:30 8:00 DRLG 12825' - 12940' (115', 14.4 FPH). Daily Total: $ 25,550

18:30 20:30 2:00 CIRC. AND COND HOLE FOR LOGS cum.wtr· $ 16,092

20:30 02:00 5:30 POOH FOR OPEN HOLE LOGS Cum. Fuel $ 80,367
02:00 02:30 0:30 LAY DOWN BIT, MM,AND IBS cum.sits: $ 63,000
02:30 03:00 0:30 RIG UP PHOENIX SURVEYS BHA
03:00 06:00 3:00 RUNNINGOPEN HOLE LOGS, INCOMPLETE BIT 1 1.00

.13 MM 1 32.96
REACHED 12,940'TD AT 18:30, 10/4/06 IBs 1 6.83
RELEASED COLUMBINE LOGGINGAT 19:30, 10/4/06 DC 18 553.81

HEUt-IVED

OCTU $ AUUb
TOTAL BHA = 594.60

L Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 255 K# LITH: 25% SH, 75% SS BKG GAS 2600
SIO 240 K# FLARE: 105' CONN GAS 3050

ROT. 245 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (d) 3520' KB PEAK GAS 5000
FUEL Used: 917 On Hand: 3439 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS



GASCO ENERGY LOGASCO df5 5,25DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy AFE#40118 S-N4 471' W109°50.016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/6/2006 28

Current Operations: LD DP AND DC
Depth: 12940TD Prog: 0 |D Hrs: 0 |AV ROP: 0.0 Formation: SPRING CANYON
DMC: $1,924 TMC: $85,249 TDC: $46,715 CWC: $1,492,986
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ 1,217
vis: 44 SPM: 110 size: surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 17/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593
Gel: 13/32/47 SPM: 0 MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: 11.8 GPM: 365 SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 870
Cake: 1 Press: 2100 Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 289 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 194 Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 82 FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 17,000
PflMf: .4/6.9 ECD: 11.1 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 45-400 WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: 5.3 Btm.Up: 68 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 449.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $1,924
06:00 9:30 3:30 PHOENIXSURVEYS RANTRIPLE COMBO NDUCTION- Misc.I Labor· $ 3,586

9:30 DENSITY-NEUTRONFROM 12,917LTDTO BASE SURF CSG cag.crew: $ -

9:30 10:00 0:30 RD PHOENIXSURVEYSAND TIH TO 3456' Daily Total: $ 46,715
10:00 16:00 6:00 SLIP AND CUT DRLG LINE cum.wtr: $ 16,092
16:00 16:30 0:30 FINISH TIH, WASH 90' TO BTM cum. Fuel $ 80,367
16:30 18:30 2:00 CIRC. ANDCOND. FOR LAYDOWN cum.sits: $ 71,624

18:30 19:30 1:00 PUMPED PILL BHA
19:30 06:00 10:30 RU FRANKS-WESTATESAND HOLDSAFETY MEETING, BIT 1 1.00

POOH LAYINGDOWN DP, BREAKKELLY Dc 18 553.81

OCT482006
TOTAL BHA = 554.81

DIVOFOIL,GA$&MININQ Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 255 K# LITH: BKG GAS
SIO 240 K# FLARE: 25' ON BTM UP CONN GAS
ROT. 245 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 759 On Hand: 2680 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP

GASCO ENERGY LOGASCO df5 5,25DAILY DRILLING REPORTEnergy AFE#40118 S-N4 471' W109°50.016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/6/2006 28

Current Operations: LD DP AND DC
Depth: 12940TD Prog: 0 |D Hrs: 0 |AV ROP: 0.0 Formation: SPRING CANYON
DMC: $1,924 TMC: $85,249 TDC: $46,715 CWC: $1,492,986
Contracte r: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ 1,217
vis: 44 SPM: 110 size: surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 17/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593
Gel: 13/32/47 SPM: 0 MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775
WL: 11.8 GPM: 365 SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 870
Cake: 1 Press: 2100 Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: 289 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 194 Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 82 FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 17,000
PflMf: .4/6.9 ECD: 11.1 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 45-400 WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: 5.3 Btm.Up: 68 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 449.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $1,924
06:00 9:30 3:30 PHOENIXSURVEYS RANTRIPLE COMBO NDUCTION- Misc.I Labor· $ 3,586

9:30 DENSITY-NEUTRONFROM 12,917LTDTO BASE SURF CSG cag.crew: $ -

9:30 10:00 0:30 RD PHOENIXSURVEYSAND TIH TO 3456' Daily Total: $ 46,715
10:00 16:00 6:00 SLIP AND CUT DRLG LINE cum.wtr: $ 16,092
16:00 16:30 0:30 FINISH TIH, WASH 90' TO BTM cum. Fuel $ 80,367
16:30 18:30 2:00 CIRC. ANDCOND. FOR LAYDOWN cum.sits: $ 71,624

18:30 19:30 1:00 PUMPED PILL BHA
19:30 06:00 10:30 RU FRANKS-WESTATESAND HOLDSAFETY MEETING, BIT 1 1.00

POOH LAYINGDOWN DP, BREAKKELLY Dc 18 553.81

OCT482006
TOTAL BHA = 554.81

DIVOFOIL,GA$&MININQ Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

PIU 255 K# LITH: BKG GAS
SIO 240 K# FLARE: 25' ON BTM UP CONN GAS
ROT. 245 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET g 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 759 On Hand: 2680 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP



GASCO GASCO ENERGY0 DAILYDRILLING REPORT
TUŸSAM 5-«

Energy AFE#40118 - 0 0.471' W109°50.016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/7/2006 29

Current Operations: CEMENT 4½" CSG
Depth: 12940TD Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0.0 Formation: SPRING CANYON

DMÇ: $915 TMC: $86,164 TDC: $182,541 CWC: $1,635,009
Contractor: Mud Co: M-I DRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

Vis: 44 SPM: 0 size: surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 17/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833

Gel: 13/32/47 SPM: 0 MFG: Prod Csg: $ 129,120 Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11.8 GPM : 0 SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 371

Cake: 1 Press: Jets: Well Head: $ 1,323 water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 9.0 JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.9 ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: 5.3 stm.up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 449.5 Daily Total: $ 130,443 Drilling Mud: $915

06:00 7:30 1:30 BREAK Ki LLY, SAVER SUB ETC. Misc. I Labor: $ 742

7:30 9:30 2:00 LD DP AND PULL WEAR BUSHING cag.crew: $ 27,562

9:30 10:30 1:00 RU FRANKS-WESTATES AND HOLD SAFETY MEETING, Daily Total: $ 52,098

10:30 20:30 10:00 RAN 4½" PRODUCTION CSG. cum.wtr: $ 16,092

20:30 21:30 1:00 RD LAY DOWNAND CSG CREWS cum.Fuel $ 80,367

21:30 01:00 3:30 CIRC. AND COND. FOR CEMENTING cum.sits: $ 71,624

01:00 2:30 1:30 INSTALL CSG HANGER AND LAND CSG. BHA

2:30 4:00 1:30 RU SCHLUMBERGER AND HOLD SAFETY MEETING,

4:00 6:00 2:00 CEMENT 4½" CSG INCOMPLETE

TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey 2° 9309'

Survey 3¼° 11117'

P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS

S/O K# FLARE: 25' ON BTM UP CONN GAS
RO¯I K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 730 On Hand: 1950 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP

GASCO GASCO ENERGY0 DAILYDRILLING REPORT
TUŸSAM 5-«

Energy AFE#40118 - 0 0.471' W109°50.016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:

SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/7/2006 29

Current Operations: CEMENT 4½" CSG
Depth: 12940TD Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0.0 Formation: SPRING CANYON

DMÇ: $915 TMC: $86,164 TDC: $182,541 CWC: $1,635,009
Contractor: Mud Co: M-I DRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

Vis: 44 SPM: 0 size: surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: 17/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,833

Gel: 13/32/47 SPM: 0 MFG: Prod Csg: $ 129,120 Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11.8 GPM : 0 SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 371

Cake: 1 Press: Jets: Well Head: $ 1,323 water: $ -

Solids: 12 AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : 9.0 JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.9 ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: 5.3 stm.up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre ik Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900

41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 449.5 Daily Total: $ 130,443 Drilling Mud: $915

06:00 7:30 1:30 BREAK Ki LLY, SAVER SUB ETC. Misc. I Labor: $ 742

7:30 9:30 2:00 LD DP AND PULL WEAR BUSHING cag.crew: $ 27,562

9:30 10:30 1:00 RU FRANKS-WESTATES AND HOLD SAFETY MEETING, Daily Total: $ 52,098

10:30 20:30 10:00 RAN 4½" PRODUCTION CSG. cum.wtr: $ 16,092

20:30 21:30 1:00 RD LAY DOWNAND CSG CREWS cum.Fuel $ 80,367

21:30 01:00 3:30 CIRC. AND COND. FOR CEMENTING cum.sits: $ 71,624

01:00 2:30 1:30 INSTALL CSG HANGER AND LAND CSG. BHA

2:30 4:00 1:30 RU SCHLUMBERGER AND HOLD SAFETY MEETING,

4:00 6:00 2:00 CEMENT 4½" CSG INCOMPLETE

TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey 2° 9309'

Survey 3¼° 11117'

P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS

S/O K# FLARE: 25' ON BTM UP CONN GAS
RO¯I K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS

FUEL Used: 730 On Hand: 1950 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP



GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/34N~2 /

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/8/2006 30

Current Operations: RD ROTARY TOOLS
Depth: 12940TD Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AVROP: 0.0 jFormation: SPRING CANYON
DMC: $0 TMC: $86,164 TDC: $89,002 CWC: $1,541,470
Contractor: Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: #1 F-1000 3.5 pm Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: 0 size: surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 16,362
Gel: SPM: Û MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,004

WL: GPM : 0 SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solida: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Coment: $ 70,736
Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

T ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 449.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

06:0Õ 07iOO¯
1:00 CMT4½" CSG W/ 815 SX HI-LIFTCMTW/ / DDS @11.5#/GAL Misc.I Labor $ -

FOLLOWEDBY 1240 SX 50-50 POZ G W/ ADDS @ 14.1 #/GAL. cag.crew: $ -

DISP WI 194 BBL 2% KCL @7.8 BPM. HADFULL RETURNS Daily Total: $ 89,002

THROUGHOUT. BUMPED PLUG WI 3516#, 800# OVER. cum.wtr: $ 16,092
FLOAT HOLDED OK. CIPJC AT 06:46, 10/7/06. Cum. Fuel $ 80,367

07:00 08:00 1:00 RD SCHLUMBERGER cum.sits: $ 71,624
08:00 09:00 1:00 CLEAN MUDPITS, RELEASED RIG BHA
09:00 18:00 9:00 RD ROTARYTOOLS

TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼ 11117'

P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O K# FLARE: 25' ON BTMUP CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 250 On Hand: 1700 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
OCf1 12006

OlV,0FOIL,GAS&

GASCO GASCO ENERGY
Ener DAILY DRILLING REPORT C/34N~2 /

AFE # 40118 GPS - N 40° 00. 471' W 109° 50. 016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/8/2006 30

Current Operations: RD ROTARY TOOLS
Depth: 12940TD Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AVROP: 0.0 jFormation: SPRING CANYON
DMC: $0 TMC: $86,164 TDC: $89,002 CWC: $1,541,470
Contractor: Mud Co: M-IDRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLECOST INTANGIBLECOST

MW: #1 F-1000 3.5 pm Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -

VIS: SPM: 0 size: surf.cag: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 16,362
Gel: SPM: Û MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,004

WL: GPM : 0 SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

Solida: AV DC: TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

PH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

PflMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Coment: $ 70,736
Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

T ak Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 449.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

06:0Õ 07iOO¯
1:00 CMT4½" CSG W/ 815 SX HI-LIFTCMTW/ / DDS @11.5#/GAL Misc.I Labor $ -

FOLLOWEDBY 1240 SX 50-50 POZ G W/ ADDS @ 14.1 #/GAL. cag.crew: $ -

DISP WI 194 BBL 2% KCL @7.8 BPM. HADFULL RETURNS Daily Total: $ 89,002

THROUGHOUT. BUMPED PLUG WI 3516#, 800# OVER. cum.wtr: $ 16,092
FLOAT HOLDED OK. CIPJC AT 06:46, 10/7/06. Cum. Fuel $ 80,367

07:00 08:00 1:00 RD SCHLUMBERGER cum.sits: $ 71,624
08:00 09:00 1:00 CLEAN MUDPITS, RELEASED RIG BHA
09:00 18:00 9:00 RD ROTARYTOOLS

TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼ 11117'

P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O K# FLARE: 25' ON BTMUP CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 250 On Hand: 1700 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP GAS

RECEIVED
OCf1 12006

OlV,0FOIL,GAS&



Form 316 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMBNo. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires Jnovember 30, 2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803
Do not use thisfonn for pmposals to chill or reenter an 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Fonn 3160-3 (APD) for such pmposals. NA

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

8. Well Name and

No.NA

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18

Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 043-047-36727

8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado Bor12 303-483-0¤44 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) Riverbend
NE NW of Section 25-T9S-R18E 11. County or Parish, State

521' FNL & 2122' FWL Uintah, Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REP3RT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent O Acidize Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

O Alter Casing Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report O Casing Repair New Construction Q Recomplete Other Meter install

O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice O Convert to Injection Plug Back Q Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the poposal is to deepen directionally or æcomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316M shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site isready for final inspection.

On Oct 27th, 2oo6 Gasco intends to install the sales meter for this well - at approximately 3:00 p.m. we will be
doing the initial calibration on this meter prior to the well being started on production.

14. l herebycertifÿ that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Beverly Walker Engineering Technician
Signature Date

Uctober 26, 2ooo

/ THISSPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATEUSE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached Approval ofthis notice does not warrant or Office
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rigits in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse) RECEIVED
Acceptedby the
Utah Division of

MI 30 EU

Oil, Gas and Mining DN.0F0 t.,GAS&MINING

For Record

Form 316 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMBNo. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires Jnovember 30, 2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803
Do not use thisfonn for pmposals to chill or reenter an 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Fonn 3160-3 (APD) for such pmposals. NA

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

8. Well Name and

No.NA

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18

Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 043-047-36727

8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado Bor12 303-483-0¤44 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) Riverbend
NE NW of Section 25-T9S-R18E 11. County or Parish, State

521' FNL & 2122' FWL Uintah, Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REP3RT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent O Acidize Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

O Alter Casing Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report O Casing Repair New Construction Q Recomplete Other Meter install

O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice O Convert to Injection Plug Back Q Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the poposal is to deepen directionally or æcomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316M shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site isready for final inspection.

On Oct 27th, 2oo6 Gasco intends to install the sales meter for this well - at approximately 3:00 p.m. we will be
doing the initial calibration on this meter prior to the well being started on production.

14. l herebycertifÿ that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Beverly Walker Engineering Technician
Signature Date

Uctober 26, 2ooo

/ THISSPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATEUSE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached Approval ofthis notice does not warrant or Office
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rigits in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse) RECEIVED
Acceptedby the
Utah Division of

MI 30 EU

Oil, Gas and Mining DN.0F0 t.,GAS&MINING

For Record



Sheep Wash Fed 21-25-9-18

Drilling CWC: $ 1,492,986

Completion - 1"*NIobe- Spring Canyon

10/25/06 MIRU JW Wireline and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray/VDL log. Fd TOC
inside of surface esg, above 3350'. RU B&C and psi test esg to 9500 psi,
ok. RIH w/ guns and perforated Stage 1 - Spring Canyon f/ 12707 - 13',
3 3/8" slick gun, 3 spf, 120 deg phased, .38 EHD, 19 gm chgs, 45.5" pen.
DC $10,735 CC $1,503,721

10/27/06 MIRU Superior Well Serv.

10/28/06 Fd 3500 SICP (from perf only). Broke dn perfs @5670 psi @4.9 bpm.
ISIP 5550. FG .88. Calc all 16 holes open. Hybrid fraced Spring Canyon
w/ 4000# 100m and 140,040# 20-40 Versa prop, using 2937 bbls 20#
linear and XL 300B gel. Screened out to 9600# w/ 20 bbls flush gone.
Left 22,000# versa prop in csg. 118,040# total in perfs. ISIP N/A.
Opened well up to FB @ l l:00 AM, w/ 5100 SICP, on 10/64" ck. Well
flowing this AM w/ 4500 FCP on 12/64" ck. Made 1174 bbls in 20 hrs.
BLWTR 1763 (SCE) DC $142,296 CC $1,646,017

10/29/06 Put well dn line @ l1:00 AM @+- 2 MMCFD w/ 4400 FCP on 12/64"
ck. TR 1226. BLWTR 1708. Final Report.

RECEIVED
OCT3 1 2006

DIVOFOIL,GAS&

Sheep Wash Fed 21-25-9-18

Drilling CWC: $ 1,492,986

Completion - 1"*NIobe- Spring Canyon

10/25/06 MIRU JW Wireline and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray/VDL log. Fd TOC
inside of surface esg, above 3350'. RU B&C and psi test esg to 9500 psi,
ok. RIH w/ guns and perforated Stage 1 - Spring Canyon f/ 12707 - 13',
3 3/8" slick gun, 3 spf, 120 deg phased, .38 EHD, 19 gm chgs, 45.5" pen.
DC $10,735 CC $1,503,721

10/27/06 MIRU Superior Well Serv.

10/28/06 Fd 3500 SICP (from perf only). Broke dn perfs @5670 psi @4.9 bpm.
ISIP 5550. FG .88. Calc all 16 holes open. Hybrid fraced Spring Canyon
w/ 4000# 100m and 140,040# 20-40 Versa prop, using 2937 bbls 20#
linear and XL 300B gel. Screened out to 9600# w/ 20 bbls flush gone.
Left 22,000# versa prop in csg. 118,040# total in perfs. ISIP N/A.
Opened well up to FB @ l l:00 AM, w/ 5100 SICP, on 10/64" ck. Well
flowing this AM w/ 4500 FCP on 12/64" ck. Made 1174 bbls in 20 hrs.
BLWTR 1763 (SCE) DC $142,296 CC $1,646,017

10/29/06 Put well dn line @ l1:00 AM @+- 2 MMCFD w/ 4400 FCP on 12/64"
ck. TR 1226. BLWTR 1708. Final Report.

RECEIVED
OCT3 1 2006

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use this fonn for proposals to cirfHor to reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abancioned well. Use Fonn 3100-3 (APD) for such proposais. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. TypeofWell NA
Oil Weil Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Sheep Wash Federal 2I-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36727
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 801 12 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec., T. R., M , or Survey Descripnon) Riverbend

i I. County or Parish, StateNE NW of Section 25-T9S-R I8E 521' FNL & 2122' FWL
Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Waler Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integnty

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinot markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involval operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or æcompletion in a new interval, a Fonn 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Noliœs shall be filed only afta all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that we will be disposing ofwater fi·omthis well as follows:

All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
the Desert Spring State Evaporation Facility NW1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E
Uintah County Utah. Which is owned by Gasco Production Company. A copy of
Gasco's approved permit is attached for your records.

Accepted by the

Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY
14. I hereby cerlify that the foregoingis true and correct.

Name (Prmted 7pped)
Title

Beverly Walky Engineering Technician
Signature Date

(a October 31, 2006
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date P * VEDConditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify thal the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. NOY0 3 2008
Title 18 U.S C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 USC Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use this fonn for proposals to cirfHor to reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abancioned well. Use Fonn 3100-3 (APD) for such proposais. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

1. TypeofWell NA
Oil Weil Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Sheep Wash Federal 2I-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36727
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 801 12 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec., T. R., M , or Survey Descripnon) Riverbend

i I. County or Parish, StateNE NW of Section 25-T9S-R I8E 521' FNL & 2122' FWL
Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Waler Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integnty

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinot markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involval operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or æcompletion in a new interval, a Fonn 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Noliœs shall be filed only afta all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that we will be disposing ofwater fi·omthis well as follows:

All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
the Desert Spring State Evaporation Facility NW1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E
Uintah County Utah. Which is owned by Gasco Production Company. A copy of
Gasco's approved permit is attached for your records.

Accepted by the

Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY
14. I hereby cerlify that the foregoingis true and correct.

Name (Prmted 7pped)
Title

Beverly Walky Engineering Technician

Signature Date
(a October 31, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date P * VEDConditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify thal the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. NOY0 3 2008
Title 18 U.S C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 USC Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.



Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use this fonn for proposals to drill orto re·enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Fonn 31&3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse sid .

7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

I. Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well Other (1 ( 8. Well Name and No.

2 NameofOperator L Sheep Wash Federal2I-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b Phone No (inc/ude area codel 43-047-36727
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 | 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or ExploraloryArea

4. Location of Well (F(NNØg€,ifc., Î., ÎL N, Of SNTVff Û€SCTÌpl/OR) Riverbend
I l. County or Parish, State

NE NW of Section 25-T9S-Rl8E 521' FNL & 2122' FWL
Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production(Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed.Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the pmposal is to deependirectionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinot markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If theoperation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(Wishall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including oclamation, have bem compleled, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

10/29/2006

14. I hereby certify that the foregoingis true and correct.
Name (Prmted 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walger Engineering Technician

Signatur Date
October 31, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

t s f approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
Title Date DECEIVED

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. NOYO3 NWTitle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the Umted
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2) blkUEUlL,GAS&MlNI

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use this fonn for proposals to drill orto re·enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Fonn 31&3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse sid .

7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

I. Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well Other (1 ( 8. Well Name and No.

2 NameofOperator L Sheep Wash Federal2I-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b Phone No (inc/ude area codel 43-047-36727
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 | 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or ExploraloryArea

4. Location of Well (F(NNØg€,ifc., Î., ÎL N, Of SNTVff Û€SCTÌpl/OR) Riverbend
I l. County or Parish, State

NE NW of Section 25-T9S-Rl8E 521' FNL & 2122' FWL
Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production(Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed.Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the pmposal is to deependirectionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinot markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If theoperation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(Wishall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including oclamation, have bem compleled, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

10/29/2006

14. I hereby certify that the foregoingis true and correct.
Name (Prmted 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walger Engineering Technician

Signatur Date
October 31, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

t s f approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
Title Date DECEIVED

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. NOYO3 NWTitle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the Umted
States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2) blkUEUlL,GAS&MlNI



Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIO I ft à OMBNo 100001¤

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31.2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to nNinfer an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 31643 (APD) for such proposals. NA

St.IBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instnictions on reverse sidB. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

I TypeofWell NA
Oil Weil Gas Weil Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 2 1-25-9- I8
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36727
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 l 12 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea
4 Locationof Well (Footage, Sec .

T, R. M. or Survey Descriptum) Riverbend
I l. County or Parish, StateNE NW of Section 25-T9S-Rl8E 521' FNL & 2122' FWL

Uintah County, Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDlCATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shul-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integnty

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon EFM Meter
Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration therof
If the proposal is to deependirectionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond unds which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involval operations if the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has beencompleted Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afta all requirements, including reclamation, have been compided, and the operator has
determined thatthesite is ready for linal inspection.

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 35oo) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is trie and correct
Name (Primed 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walkpr Engineering Technician

Signatu e Date
October 31, 2006

THIS SPMCE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
RECH VED

Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office NOVO32006
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the tebS &MININGStates any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction DN,OF ,

(Instructions on page

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIO I ft à OMBNo 100001¤

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31.2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to nNinfer an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 31643 (APD) for such proposals. NA

St.IBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instnictions on reverse sidB. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

I TypeofWell NA
Oil Weil Gas Weil Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Sheep Wash Federal 2 1-25-9- I8
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36727
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 l 12 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea
4 Locationof Well (Footage, Sec .

T, R. M. or Survey Descriptum) Riverbend
I l. County or Parish, StateNE NW of Section 25-T9S-Rl8E 521' FNL & 2122' FWL

Uintah County, Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDlCATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shul-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integnty

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon EFM Meter
Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration therof
If the proposal is to deependirectionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond unds which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involval operations if the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has beencompleted Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afta all requirements, including reclamation, have been compided, and the operator has
determined thatthesite is ready for linal inspection.

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 35oo) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is trie and correct
Name (Primed 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walkpr Engineering Technician

Signatu e Date
October 31, 2006

THIS SPMCE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
RECH VED

Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant os
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office NOVO32006
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the tebS &MININGStates any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction DN,OF ,

(Instructions on page



Form 3130-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERlOR OMB NO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. Lease Serial No.

( I-9803

la. Type of Well O Oil Well S Gas Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: New Work Over Deepen Plug Back Diff Resvr. NA
Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

NA2. Name of Operator
8. Lease Name and Well No.

Gasco Production Compan i i !I I 1 I Eli Sheep Wash Fed 21-25-9-18
3. Address 3a. Phone No (include area code) 9. API Well No.
8 Inverness Drive East Suite 100. Englewood. Colorado 80\11 303-483-0044 43-047-36727
4. Location of Well (Report locations clear/v and in accordance irith Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surince 52 I' FNI. & 1122' En I. NI N\\ Riverbend

I 1. Sec., T., R., M.. or Block and
At top prod. interval reported below same surveyor Area sec25-T9s-R is!

12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth Same Uinlah I hah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D Reached 16. te Complete 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT. GI.)*

D & A Ready to Prod.06 25/06 IfWû5 06 492l.I' GI & 4939.1' KB

18. Total Depth: MD 12.940 19 Plug Back T.D MD 20. Depth I ridge Plug Set: MD NA
TVD I2 94() TVD TVD NA

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22 Was well No O Yes (Submit copy)
Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)

GR: MI,: 0 NL: 0 81 Directional Ô No O Yes(Submil copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report al/strmgs set in well)
Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry VolHole Size Size/Grade Wl. (#lft.) fop (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount PulledDepth 1ype of Cement (BBL)

20" 0 40

17 I/2" 13 3/8 H40 48# 0 217 225 sx of Class G Cire to surf
12 1/4" 8 5/8 .1-55 32# a 3502 700 si of Class G Cire in Surf
77/8" 41/2PII0 135# 0 12931 Bl5stofililill circiosurf

24.S bing Recordpth
Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)

15. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf Status
Blackhank 12.707 12.713 12.707 - 12.713 .38 18 Open

:}

7. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.
Depth Interval Amount and type of Material flECEIVED

12.707 - 12.713 Ilybrid fraced Spring Canyon nii000# 100m and 140 040# 20WO Versa prop. using 2937 bbis 20# linear and 0 I

DIVOFnil tu? AMINING
8. Production - Interval A
late First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
roduced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr API Gravity
0/29/06 10 30/06 24 4 40 2,42 I 160 Flowing

boke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
ize Flwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr API
14/64 SI o 3262 9 40 2,421 160 Producing from A
Ba.
ate Firs! Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
roduced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr API Gravity

boke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr Oli Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
ize Flwg Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr API

SI
Vee instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse

Form 3130-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERlOR OMB NO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. Lease Serial No.

( I-9803

la. Type of Well O Oil Well S Gas Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: New Work Over Deepen Plug Back Diff Resvr. NA
Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

NA
2. Name of Operator

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Gasco Production Compan i i !I I 1 I Eli Sheep Wash Fed 21-25-9-18
3. Address 3a. Phone No (include area code)

9. API Well No.
8 Inverness Drive East Suite 100. Englewood. Colorado 80\11 303-483-0044 43-047-36727
4. Location of Well (Report locations clear/v and in accordance irith Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surince 52 I' FNI. & 1122' En I. NI N\\ Riverbend

I 1. Sec., T., R., M.. or Block and
At top prod. interval reported below same surveyor Area sec25-T9s-R is!

12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth Same Uinlah I hah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D Reached 16. te Complete 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT. GI.)*

D & A Ready to Prod.06 25/06 IfWû5 06 492l.I' GI & 4939.1' KB

18. Total Depth: MD 12.940 19 Plug Back T.D MD 20. Depth I ridge Plug Set: MD NA
TVD I2 94() TVD TVD NA

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22 Was well No O Yes (Submit copy)
Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)

GR: MI,: 0 NL: 0 81 Directional Ô No O Yes(Submil copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report al/strmgs set in well)
Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry VolHole Size Size/Grade Wl. (#lft.) fop (MD) Bottom (MD) Cement Top* Amount PulledDepth 1ype of Cement (BBL)

20" 0 40

17 I/2" 13 3/8 H40 48# 0 217 225 sx of Class G Cire to surf
12 1/4" 8 5/8 .1-55 32# a 3502 700 si of Class G Cire in Surf
77/8" 41/2PII0 135# 0 12931 Bl5stofililill circiosurf

24.S bing Recordpth

Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Set (MD)

15. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf Status
Blackhank 12.707 12.713 12.707 - 12.713 .38 18 Open

:}

7. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.
Depth Interval Amount and type of Material flECEIVED

12.707 - 12.713 Ilybrid fraced Spring Canyon nii000# 100m and 140 040# 20WO Versa prop. using 2937 bbis 20# linear and 0 I

DIVOFnil tu? AMINING
8. Production - Interval A
late First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
roduced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr API Gravity

0/29/06 10 30/06 24 4 40 2,42 I 160 Flowing
boke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
ize Flwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr API

14/64 SI o 3262 9 40 2,421 160 Producing from A
Ba.
ate Firs! Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
roduced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr API Gravity

boke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr Oli Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
ize Flwg Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr API

SI

Vee instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse



28b.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity uction Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

Si

28c. Production - Interval E
Date First Test Hours Tes! Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Produc on .BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg Press Rale BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (So/d used forfuel vented etc.)

Sold
30 Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (I og) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents Ihereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shul-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas Depth

Wasatch 5.422 9,279
Dark Canyon 9.279 9.543
Mesaverde 9,543 I 1.789
Blackhawk 12,047 Well was td'd within the Blackhawk @12,940

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procer ure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:

1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs ( I full set reg'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Repon 4 Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. I hereby cenify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

me (pr

/

B k ie ring Tech

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, tictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

oU S. GPO:

28b.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity uction Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

Si

28c. Production - Interval E
Date First Test Hours Tes! Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Produc on .BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg Press Rale BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (So/d used forfuel vented etc.)

Sold
30 Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (I og) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents Ihereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shul-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas Depth

Wasatch 5.422 9,279
Dark Canyon 9.279 9.543
Mesaverde 9,543 I 1.789
Blackhawk 12,047 Well was td'd within the Blackhawk @12,940

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procer ure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:

1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs ( I full set reg'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Repon 4 Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. I hereby cenify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

me (pr

/

B k ie ring Tech

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, tictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

oU S. GPO:



Form3160-s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
t^Pr"2°°4 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5 Lease Serial No
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use firis form for proposals to drill or to r!Mmter an 6 If Indian. Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 31&3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

i TypeofWell NA
Oil well Gas well othe, 8 Well Name and No.

2 Name of Operalor Sheep Wash Federal 2 I -25-9- I8
Gasco Production Company 9 ^PI well No
3a. Address 3b Phone No (melude area code) 43-047-36727

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood. Co 80I l2 | 303-483-0044 10 Fieldand Pool,orExploralory Area
4 Locationof Well (Footage. See . T. IL M . or Surrer nevnpuma Riverbend

I I Couniv or Parish. StateNE NW of Section 25-T9S-R18E 521' FNL & 2122' FWL
.

Uintah County, Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE lšOX(S) T() INDR ATE NATLIRE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inlent Aadize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-o f

Altenny Casmg Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrily

Subsequent Repon Casing Repan New Construction Recomplete Other Site Secunty

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon diagram - submitial

Final Abandonment Notice Conven to injecnon Plug back Waler Disposal

13 Descnbe Proposed or Completed operations(cleady slate all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duratron thereal
if the proposal is to deepen dirœtionally or recomplete honzontally. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on liie with Bl.M/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvtxl operations If Ihe operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Nonces shall be filed only after all nyuirements, including reclamation, have bem compleled, and the operak>f has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

Please findaliached a copy of the site security diagram for this well

Accepted by the
Utah Division of ECEIVED

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY
UG08 200

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING
14 I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (l'rmted /pped)
Title

Beverly Walkyr Engineering Technician
signature Date

August 2, 2007
THIS SNE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval. if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrani or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those nyhis in the subject lease Office
which would entitle lhe applicant lo conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 USC Section 1001 AND Title 43 USC Section 1212. make it a came for any person knowingly and willfillly to make any depanment or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statementsor representations as to any matter within ils ¡unsdicnon

(Indruenons on page

Form3160-s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
t^Pr"2°°4 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5 Lease Serial No
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use firis form for proposals to drill or to r!Mmter an 6 If Indian. Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 31&3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No
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12. CHECK APPROPRIATE lšOX(S) T() INDR ATE NATLIRE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
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Subsequent Repon Casing Repan New Construction Recomplete Other Site Secunty

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon diagram - submitial

Final Abandonment Notice Conven to injecnon Plug back Waler Disposal

13 Descnbe Proposed or Completed operations(cleady slate all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duratron thereal
if the proposal is to deepen dirœtionally or recomplete honzontally. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on liie with Bl.M/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvtxl operations If Ihe operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Nonces shall be filed only after all nyuirements, including reclamation, have bem compleled, and the operak>f has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

Please findaliached a copy of the site security diagram for this well

Accepted by the
Utah Division of ECEIVED

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY
UG08 200

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING
14 I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (l'rmted /pped)
Title

Beverly Walkyr Engineering Technician

signature Date
August 2, 2007

THIS SNE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval. if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrani or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those nyhis in the subject lease Office
which would entitle lhe applicant lo conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 USC Section 1001 AND Title 43 USC Section 1212. make it a came for any person knowingly and willfillly to make any depanment or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statementsor representations as to any matter within ils ¡unsdicnon

(Indruenons on page
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Lease #
UTU-9803

POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING PRODUCTION/BLOWDOWN
This lease is subject to theValves Line Purpose Position Seal Installed Site Security Plan for GASCO

D Drain Closed Yes Production Company. The
Closed Plan is located at
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8 Inverness Drive EastO Overflow Open/Closed No Suite 100
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S Sales Closed Yes SWF 21-25-9-18
| Inlet Closed N° NE/NW Sec. 25 Twp. 9S Rge. 18EO Overflow Closed No
B Blowdown Closed No Uintah County, Utah
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O yon s ia s,w
GASCO GASCO ENERGY 93-of636
E. DAILY DRILLING REPORTnergy AFE#40118 GPS-N40°00.471' W109°50.016'

Well: Permit Depth: Prog Depth: Date: Day:
SWF 21-25-9-18 13,036 12,924 10/6/2006 28

Current Operations: LD DP AND DC
Depth: 12940TD Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0.0 Formation: SPRING CANYON
DMC: $1,924 TMC: $85,249 TDC: $46,715 CWC: $1,492,986
Contractor: Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

MW: 10.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm Bit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ 1,217
vis: 44 SPM: 110 size: surf.csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVIYP: 17/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,593
Gel: 13/32/47 SPM: 0 MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,775

WL: 11.8 GPM : 365 SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 870
Cake: 1 Press: 2100 Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -

solids: 12 AV DC: 289 TD Out: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ -

Sand: AV DP: 194 Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 Jetvel: 82 FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 17,000
PflMf: .4/6.9 ECD: 11.1 Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 12000 SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

ca : 120 SPR #2 : 45-400 WOB: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Dapp ppb: 5.3 Btm.Up: 68 R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -

Time Bre =k Down: Total D.T. M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
41.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 449.5 Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $1,924

06:00 9:30 3:30 PHOENIX SURVEYS RAN TRIPLE COMBO NDUCTION- Misc.ILabor: $ 3,586
9:30 DENSITY-NEUTRON FROM 12,917LTD TO BASE SURF CSG csg.crew: $ -

9:30 10:00 0:30 RD PHOENIX SURVEYS AND TIH TO 3456' Daily Total: $ 46,715

10:00 16:00 6:00 SLIP AND CUT DRLG LINE cum.wtr: $ 16,092
16:00 16:30 0:30 FINISH TIH,WASH 90' TO BTM Cum.Fuel $ 80,367
16:30 18:30 2:00 CIRC. AND COND. FOR LAYDOWN Cum. Bits: $ 71,624

18:30 19:30 1:00 PUMPED PlLL BHA

19:30 06:00 10:30 RU FRANKS-WESTATES AND HOLD SAFETY MEETING, BIT 1 1.00
POOH LAYING DOWN DP, BREAK KELLY DC 18 553.81

RECEIVED
OFCn6 2nO7

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MNNP TOTAL BHA = 554.81

Survey 2° 9309'
Survey 3¼° 11117'

P/U 255 K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O 240 K# FLARE: 25' ON BTM UP CONN GAS
ROT. 245 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3520' KB PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 759 On Hand: 2680 Co.Man V GUINN TRIP
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Fonn316o-s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expim:MarchM,2007

5. Lease SerialNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to driH or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned weH. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
NA1. Type of WellO- U- Ooger 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Sheep Wash Federal21-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (Include ama code) 43-047-36727
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R., M., or SurveyDescripuon) Riverbend
11. County or Parish, State

NE NW of Section 25-T9S-RISE 52 l' FNL & 2122' FWL Uintah County, Utah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production{ Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

SubsequentReport Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposedor CompletedOperations(clearlystate all pertinentdetails,includingestimatedstarting dateof any pmposedwork and appmximate dumtionthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurfacelocationsand measured andtrue vertical depthsof all pertinentmarkem and zones.
Attachthe Bondunder which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA Requiredsubsequentreports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If tle opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testinghas beencompleted. Final AbandonmentNoticesshallbe filed only after all requirements, includingteclamation, have been completed, and the opetator has
determinedthatthe site isready for finalinspection.

COPYSENTTOOPEAATOR

Current Status Producing fPomthe Lower Mesaverde Date: 1 * M ' NS
Perfs: See attached wellbore diagram g.

Gasco intends to recomplete this well by perforating and fracturestimulating all remaining
productive intervals in the Mesaverde formationin an effort to increase oil and gas production.

A subsequent report will be submitted within 30 days of completion giving details of the actual work
performed.

14. I hereby certify thatthe foregoing is true and correct.
Name[Printed/ Typed)

Matt Owens Petroleum Engineer

Signa Date

THI SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date Û
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of thisnotice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office (), FederalApprovaOfThis
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Ÿitle43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to mdl ' the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(hastructionson page 2)

ÑOV24 2008
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

Fonn316o-s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo.1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expim:MarchM,2007

5. Lease SerialNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to driH or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned weH. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
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12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production{ Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

SubsequentReport Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposedor CompletedOperations(clearlystate all pertinentdetails,includingestimatedstarting dateof any pmposedwork and appmximate dumtionthereof
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurfacelocationsand measured andtrue vertical depthsof all pertinentmarkem and zones.
Attachthe Bondunder which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA Requiredsubsequentreports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If tle opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testinghas beencompleted. Final AbandonmentNoticesshallbe filed only after all requirements, includingteclamation, have been completed, and the opetator has
determinedthatthe site isready for finalinspection.

COPYSENTTOOPEAATOR

Current Status Producing fPomthe Lower Mesaverde Date: 1 * M ' NS
Perfs: See attached wellbore diagram g.

Gasco intends to recomplete this well by perforating and fracturestimulating all remaining
productive intervals in the Mesaverde formationin an effort to increase oil and gas production.

A subsequent report will be submitted within 30 days of completion giving details of the actual work
performed.

14. I hereby certify thatthe foregoing is true and correct.
Name[Printed/ Typed)

Matt Owens Petroleum Engineer

Signa Date

THI SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date Û
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of thisnotice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office (), FederalApprovaOfThis
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Ÿitle43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to mdl ' the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(hastructionson page 2)

ÑOV24 2008
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



LEASE: U-9803 WELL #: Sheep Wash Federal21-25-9-18
FIELD: Riverbend

LOCATION: 521' FNL & 2122' FWL NE NW
COUNTY: Uintah ST: Utah API: 43-047-36727

GL: 4921'

SPUD DATE: 6/25/2006
COMP DATE: 10/29/2006

CONDUCTOR
SIZE: 13 3/8"
WT/GRD: H-40 DATE FIRST PRODUCED 10/29/06

WT/GRD: 48# PRODUCTIONMETHOD flow
CSA: 217' CHOKE SIZE 14/64
SX: 225 sx ClassG Csg PRESSURE 3262
CIRC: Y I | OIL(BBL) 40
TOC: Surf I I GAS(MCF) 2421
HOLE SIZE: 17 1/2" I I WATER (BBL) 160

I I
SURFACE CASING

SIZE: 8 5/8"
WT/GRD: J-55
WT/GRD: 32#
CSA: 3,502
SX: 700 sx ClassG

CIRC: Y
TOC: Surf
HOLE SIZE: 12 1/4"

PRODUCTION CASING
SIZE: 4 1/2"
WT/GRD: P110
WT/GRD: 13.5#
CSA: 12,666
SX: 815 sx Hi-Lift

1240 sx 50/50 Poz
CIRC: Y
TOC: Inside Surf
HOLE SIZE: 7 7/8"

Stimulation
Stage 6:

Stage 5:

Stage 4:

Stage 3:

Stage 2:
Stage 1

= 12707-13 FORMATION = Spring Canyon

Stage 1: ybrid fraced Spring Canyon w/4000# 100m and
10/26/2006 40,040#20-40 Versa prop, using 2937 bbis 20#linea No POBS (3/13/08)

nd XL 300B gel

PBTD @ No Tubing (3-13-08)

MD
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> Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004.0137

I BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to dr¡II or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD)for such proposals. NA

SUBNIIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse sidG. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
NA1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36727

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Wel1(Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Riverbend

11. County or Parish, StateNE NW of Section 25-T9S-R18E 521' FNL & 2122' FWL
Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Site Security

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Desciibe Proposed or CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measuredand true vertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attachthe Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvedopemtions. If the operation resultsin a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 31604 shall be filedonce
testinghas been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthat the site isready forfinalinspection.

Please findattached a copy ofthe site security diagram for this well

RECEIVED
DEC15 2008

DIROFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Jessica Berg Production Clerk

Signature Date
December 11, 2008

THIS CE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page

> Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004.0137

I BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-9803

Do not use this form for proposals to dr¡II or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD)for such proposals. NA

SUBNIIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse sidG. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
NA1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator Sheep Wash Federal 21-25-9-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36727

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Wel1(Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) Riverbend

11. County or Parish, StateNE NW of Section 25-T9S-R18E 521' FNL & 2122' FWL
Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Site Security

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Water Disposal

13. Desciibe Proposed or CompletedOperations(clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measuredand true vertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attachthe Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involvedopemtions. If the operation resultsin a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form 31604 shall be filedonce
testinghas been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthat the site isready forfinalinspection.

Please findattached a copy ofthe site security diagram for this well

RECEIVED
DEC15 2008

DIROFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

Title
Jessica Berg Production Clerk

Signature Date
December 11, 2008

THIS CE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page
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API Well No: 43047367270000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-9803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0521 FNL 2122 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

3/1/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco intends to resume recompletion activities on this well by stimulating all
remaining zones in the Mesaverde formation.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Matt Owens

TITLE
 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2/3/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 483-0044  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 996-1839

February 03, 2010

February 03, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047367270000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EAs0E DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0521 FNL 2122 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

3/1/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to resume recompletion activities on this well by stimulating all
remaining zones in the Mesaverde formation. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Fe aty 0 2010

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/3/2010

RECEIVED February 03,

iPI Well No: 43047367270000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EAs0E DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0521 FNL 2122 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

3/1/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to resume recompletion activities on this well by stimulating all
remaining zones in the Mesaverde formation. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: Fe aty 0 2010

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/3/2010

RECEIVED February 03,



API Well No: 43047367270000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-9803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0521 FNL 2122 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

3/3/2010

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco perforated and fracture treated this well starting 2/27/2010 as follows:
Perf:12482-85, 12541-44, 12598-602. Pump 2,016# 100 mesh, 73,181#

30/50 white sand,8,000# 30/50 resin coated sand, 1,935 bbls Perf:
12075-78, 12135-37, 12189-91, 12235-37, 12259-61, 12318-20. Pump

4,284# 100 mesh sand, 150,651# 30/50 white, 17,100# 30/50 resin coated
sand, 4,086 bbls Perf: 11583-86, 11644-46, 11714-16, 11741-44. Pump

/3,171# 100 mesh sand, 96,069# 30/50 white sand, 13,996# 30/50 resin
coated sand, 2,525 bbls Perf: 11224-28, 11330-32, 11462-66. Pump 3150#
100 mesh sand, 113,922# 30/50 white sand, 12,600# 30/50 resin coated
sand, 2,582 bbls Perf: 10930-34, 11070-76. Pump 1,659# 100 mesh sand, 61,541# 30/50 white sand,
6,750# 30/50 resin coated sand, 1,463 bbls Perf: 9325-30, 9361-64, 9538-40. Pump 3,633 100 mesh

sand, 140,771# 30/50 white sand, 14,400# 30/50 Resin coated sand, 3,148 bbls

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Matt Owens

TITLE
 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3/8/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
303 483-0044  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 996-1839

March 08, 2010

March 09, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047367270000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE3DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0521 FNL 2122 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

3/3/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco perforated and fracture treated this well starting 2/27/2010 as follows:
Perf:12482-85, 12541-44, 12598-602. Pump 2,016# 100 mesh, 73,181# Accepted by the

30/50 white sand,8,000# 30/50 resin coated sand, 1,935 bbls Perf: Utah Division of
12075-78, 12135-37, 12189-91, 12235-37, 12259-61, 12318-20. Pum;Oil, Gas and Mining

4,284# 100 mesh sand, 150,651# 30/50 white, 17,100# 30/50 resin Pmt RE D ON LYsand, 4,086 bbls Perf: 11583-86, 11644-46, 11714-16, 11741-44. P¯ump - -

, zunr
/3,171# 100 mesh sand, 96,069# 30/50 white sand, 13,996# 30/50 resin

coated sand, 2,525 bbls Perf: 11224-28, 11330-32, 11462-66. Pump 3150#
100 mesh sand, 113,922# 30/50 white sand, 12,600# 30/50 resin coated
sand, 2,582 bbls Perf: 10930-34, 11070-76. Pump 1,659# 100 mesh sand, 61,541# 30/50 white sand,
6,750# 30/50 resin coated sand, 1,463 bbls Perf: 9325-30, 9361-64, 9538-40. Pump 3,633 100 mesh

sand, 140,771# 30/50 white sand, 14,400# 30/50 Resin coated sand, 3,148 bbls

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/8/2010

RECEIVED March 08,

iPI Well No: 43047367270000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE3DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0521 FNL 2122 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

3/3/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

O DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco perforated and fracture treated this well starting 2/27/2010 as follows:
Perf:12482-85, 12541-44, 12598-602. Pump 2,016# 100 mesh, 73,181# Accepted by the

30/50 white sand,8,000# 30/50 resin coated sand, 1,935 bbls Perf: Utah Division of
12075-78, 12135-37, 12189-91, 12235-37, 12259-61, 12318-20. Pum;Oil, Gas and Mining

4,284# 100 mesh sand, 150,651# 30/50 white, 17,100# 30/50 resin Pmt RE D ON LYsand, 4,086 bbls Perf: 11583-86, 11644-46, 11714-16, 11741-44. P¯ump - -

, zunr
/3,171# 100 mesh sand, 96,069# 30/50 white sand, 13,996# 30/50 resin

coated sand, 2,525 bbls Perf: 11224-28, 11330-32, 11462-66. Pump 3150#
100 mesh sand, 113,922# 30/50 white sand, 12,600# 30/50 resin coated
sand, 2,582 bbls Perf: 10930-34, 11070-76. Pump 1,659# 100 mesh sand, 61,541# 30/50 white sand,
6,750# 30/50 resin coated sand, 1,463 bbls Perf: 9325-30, 9361-64, 9538-40. Pump 3,633 100 mesh

sand, 140,771# 30/50 white sand, 14,400# 30/50 Resin coated sand, 3,148 bbls

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Matt Owens 303 996-1839 Petroleum Engineer

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/8/2010

RECEIVED March 08,



API Well No: 43047367270000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-9803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0521 FNL 2122 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

10/15/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco would like to dispose of water at LaPoint Recycle & Storage state
approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 12 Township 5 south
Range 19 west in LaPoint UT. This facility would be used in addition to the

currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water from
this well.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Roger Knight 303 996-1803

TITLE
 EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10/8/2010

October 08, 2010

October 13, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047367270000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE3DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0521 FNL 2122 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at LaPoint Recycle & Storage state
approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 12 Township 5 soutAccepted by the

Range 19 west in LaPoint UT. This facility would be used in addition to the Utah Division of
currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water fDIT Gas and Mining

this well. FOR REÇggggY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/8/2010

RECEIVED October 08,

iPI Well No: 43047367270000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE3DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0521 FNL 2122 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/15/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at LaPoint Recycle & Storage state
approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 12 Township 5 soutAccepted by the

Range 19 west in LaPoint UT. This facility would be used in addition to the Utah Division of
currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of water fDIT Gas and Mining

this well. FOR REÇggggY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/8/2010

RECEIVED October 08,



API Well No: 43047367270000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-9803 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 8 MILE FLAT NORTH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0521 FNL 2122 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

1/1/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in addition
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose of

water from this well.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/31/2010

December 31, 2010

01/05/2011

iPI Well No: 43047367270000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE3DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0521 FNL 2122 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,

iPI Well No: 43047367270000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EASOE3DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen e×isting wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047367270000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext 8 MILE FLAT NORTH

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0521 FNL 2122 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 25 Township: 09.05 Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

1/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the

Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additiolUtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose il, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR REGORO(OINLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Production Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/31/2010

RECEIVED December 31,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only 

Effective Date· 4/16/2015 
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERA TOR: 
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265 
7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237 
303-996-1805 303-996-1805 

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV 

WELL INFORMATION: 
Well Name API 
See Attached List 

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION: 
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015 
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015 
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143 

REVIEW: 
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: 
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015 
4. OPS/SIITA welles) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1120/2016 
5. VIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A 
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None 
7. Inspections ofPA statelfee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION: 
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 

2. Indian welles) covered by Bond Number: 
3.State/fee welles) covered by Bond Number(s): 

DATA ENTRY: 

1. Welles) update in the OGIS on: 

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 

3. Unites) operator number update in OGIS on: 
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: 
5. StatelFee welles) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION: 

SUR0027842 
N/A 
SUR0027845 
SUR0035619 -FCB 

1122/2016 
1122/2016 
1122/2016 
N/A 
1122/2016 
N/A 

N/A 
6/2/2015 

N/A 

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division 
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1122/2016 
COMMENTS: 

1/22/2016 

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265
7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237
303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUROO27842
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUROO27845

SUROO35619-FCB

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 1/22/2016
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 1/22/2016
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016
COMMENTS:



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

Well Name -
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 

-------
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 
FEDERAL 31-21 G-9-19 
Federal 323-29-9-19 
Federal 421-29-9-19 
Federal 322-29-9-1 9 
Federal 43 1 -29-9-1 9 
Federal 432-29-9-1 9 
Federal 414-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 

.. _--

-----_._- -
federal 321-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 
Federal 212-29-9-19 
State 321-32-9-19 
State 423-32-9-19 
State 421-32-9-19 
State 413-32-9-1 9 
State 323-32-9-1 9 
State 431-32-9-19 ---
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 

-
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-1 0-1 7 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-1 1-16 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 

-----
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 
SQUA W CROSSING U 5 
RBU 5-lID -
FEDERAL 7-25A 

Section 
18 
17 
18 
29 
20 
21 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
36 
36 
36 
30 
29 
23 
26 
19 
17 
21 
32 
20 
17 
19 
32 
4 
32 
29 
16 
16 
29 
8 
16 
20 
20 
4 
22 
24 
2 
11 

------

25 

TWN 'RNG API Number Enti!Y 
090S 190E 4304752496 
090S 190E 4304752522 
090S 190E 4304752538 ' 
090S 190E 4304752544 

. '.' 

090S 190E 4304752545 
090S 190E 4304752546 
090S 190E 4304753026 
090S 190E 4304753027 
090S 190E 4304753029 ; 
090S 190E 4304753030 
090S 190E 4304753031 i 
090S 190E 4304753070 
090S 190E 4304753073 
090S 190E 4304753076 
090S 190E 4304753078 
090S 190E 4304753079 , 
090S 190E 4304753080 
090S 190E 4304753133 1 
090S 190E 4304754479 
090S 190E 4304754480 
090S 190E 4304754481 
090S 190E 4304754482 ! 

090S 190E 4304754483 
090S 190E 4304754529 
090S 180E 4304754541 
090S 180E 4304754542 
090S 180E 4304754543 
090S 190E 4304753012 19650 
100S 170E 4301333098 15941 
090S 190E 4304736915 16556 
090S 180E 4304738573 17201 
090S 190E 4304739777 18344 
O9OS 190E 4304739800 17202 
1I0S 150E 4301332391 13787 
100S 170E 4301332447 14033 
1l0S 150E 4301332475 14417 
100S 170E 4301332560 -14726 
1l0S 160E 4301332611 14439 
100S ,170E 4301332619 15649 
11 OS 170E 4301332674 15537 

' 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 
100S 170E 4301332679 14033 
1I0S 150E 4301332685 16082 
100S 170E 4301332730 15243 
100S 170E 4301332773 15370 
1I0S 170E 4301332778 14802 
1I0S 160E 4301332888 15098 
100S 170E 4301333081 15714 
100S 1 70E '4301333087 i 15807 
11 OS 170E 4301333099 ' 15920 
1I0S 140E 4301333437 16919 
1I0S ,140E 4301333443 16367 
100S 180E 4304730129 16266 
100S ! 180E 4304730409 9005 

I 

090S 180E I4304730624 19030 

Mineral Surface Type Status 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal 'GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 

---
Federal Federal GW APD 
'Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
Federal Federal GW DRL 

--

Federal Federal GW OPS 
Fee Fee GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal ,GW OPS 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P ---
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Eederal GW P 

.. -

Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State 'OW P 
Federal Federal OW P --
Federal Federal OW P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

WellName Section TWN RNGAPINumber Entity Mineral Surface TypeiStatus
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304752522 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752538 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304752544 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304752545 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304752546 Federal Federal OW APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753026 Federal_ Federal GW APD
Federa1421-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753027 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753029 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1431-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753030 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753031 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1414-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753070 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753073 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753076 Federal Federal GW APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753078 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753079 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753080 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753133 Federal Federal GW APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754479 State State GW APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754480 State State GW APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754481 State State GW APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754482 State State GW APD

te 323-32-9-19 32 0908 190E 4304754483 State State GW APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754529 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754541 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754542 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754543 State State GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 1108 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State_ State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-l l-17 4 110S 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-ll-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 l10S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 l10S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW P
RBU 5-11D 11 l00S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU6-2D 
NGC 33-18J 
RBU 13-2D 

2 
18 
2 

-.-------~--~~----~~--

RBU 16-3D 3 
-----

RBU 1O-1lD 11 
RBU 8-10D 10 
RBU 15-3D 3 
RBU 12-12D 12 
RBU2-10D 10 
RBU 3-15D 15 
RBU 3-12D 12 

--

STATE 7-36A 36 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 
STATE4-32B 32 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 
L YTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 

--

FED 11-21-9-19 21 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 

- -

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 

----
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 

-~ ~--

DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 

--
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 

- --_._--

DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 

-
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 

100S 180EI4304731190 7075 State State OW P 
090S 190E:4304731200 16155 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180Ei4304731280 16267 State State OW P 

----

100S 180E 14304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 1180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 

-+-- ---- c----
100S 1180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
100S ~~304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180EI4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 14304731801 110784 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW IP 
090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 14304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734169 14140 'Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734202 113455 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P 
100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170EI4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734607 :13640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E:4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P 

-~ 

090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735405 114928 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW IP 
090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E!4304735623 i 14640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P 
090S 190E4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P 
100S 180E'4304735808 !15592 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 190E 4304735844 114356 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P 
090S 190E 14304736093 i 14976 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P ---f----

090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P 
090S 180E!4304736220 14763 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P +---
090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P 
090S 190E '4304736271 115884 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P 

---
090S 190E !4304736442 .15715 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E ;4304736600 ! 14977 Federal Federal GW P 
090S I 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW ,P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU6i-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State ONV P
14GiC33-18J 18 090S 190E ‡304731200 6155 Federal Federal DNV P
FU3U13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State CA¥ P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
FU3tJ 10-111) 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal ()VV P
FU3t] 8-10L) 10 100S 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal ()?V JP
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU2-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federed Federed Cygr p
IUBU3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federed Federed CA¥ P
FU3U3-12D 12 100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federed Federal OMT P
STATE7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 Sutte Smte GMT P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFLAL23-29#l 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FE]D44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federed (ITV P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FEI342-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GYV P
PETESM'ASH23-12#1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federed Federal GNV P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FEl3 14-18-2 #1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Fedenal Federal GB¥ P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FEI3 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GVV P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFDAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Fedenal Feden11 GMT P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEE)EFLAL41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Feden11 (39V P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P
LikNIB TItUST24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GMT P
FEEIEftAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E =‡304735808 15592 Federal Federal (39V P
FEDERAL21-6-10-19 6 100S 190E 4304735844 14356 Federed Federed GNV P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STitTE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GVV P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEEIEftAL23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 43047369‡42 15715 Federal Federal (svV P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 
-----

FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 
~HEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 -----_ .. _. __ ._--

FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 

--

----------.. -------

----_. __ . __ ._----_._._._._ .... -

FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 
----------

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 

125 090S 180E i4304736727 '15475 Federal Federal 
--

30 090S 190E'4304736739 !15476 Federal Federal 
-------
25 090S 180E'4304736740 15213 Federal Federal 
19 090S 190E 14304736771 

-----

15355 Federal Federal 
-- , -

~L ____ f?90S :180EI4304736772 15338 Federal Federal 
f-----'---+---

30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal 
--

22 090S 190E 14304736913 15187 Fee Fee 
- -- ------- - -- ----f-------

LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E:4304736916 : 17012 Fee Fee --_._----

DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180Ei4304737115 115011 State State 
.... __ .. _._---_.--- -_ .. --------

FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 '090S .190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal 

.--------- -- 1--

UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 14304737132 15087 i State State 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E i4304737338 ! 15365 State State 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E :4304737611 116311 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S i 190E!4304737612 16051 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 119OE[4304737613 16052 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S '190E:4304737621 16253 !Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E I4304737622 16264 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E :4304737630 16557 Federal Federal 
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E

'
4304737631 15961 Federal Federal 

~ 

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 1180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S : 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E !430473767616254 iState State 

----

180E4304737677h5806 State UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S State 
---- c---

UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S ,180E'4304738028 16868 State State 
-- 1-----

FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S ',190E 4304738336 116467 Federal Federal 
1-------

190E 4304738337 116119 IFederal Federal FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S --------------f-----

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E4304738351 16884 Federal Federal 
--- -

180E~4304738352 ~~ WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 16349 Federal Federal _.-----

SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E [4304738353 16210 Federal Federal 
-

FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S : 190E 4304738407 ; 16236 Federal Federal 
--

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E!4304738465 16558 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180EI4304738469 16449 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal 
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S ,190E 4304738673 : 15832 Fee Fee 
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S 180E4304738896 16792 Federal Federal 
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E:4304739170 16309 State State 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S : 190EI4304739171 16308 State State 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 1 190E 4304739172 116310 State State 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E!4304739717 17054 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E,4304739729 17241 Federal Federal -
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 ! 17266 Federal Federal 

. -------. 
4304739773 -: 17013 ,Federal DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E Federal .... -.--_ ..... -

FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E4304740233 17014 Federal Federal 
- - - -

FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E:4304751280 18211 Federal Federal ---------------c------ c---
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190Ei4304751281 18210 Federal Federal 

----f----
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S : 190E 4304752870_1~64? IFederal Federal -------------------r--------- c----

~~~~~~ !;~:~~:~:! ~ 30 090S 190E14304752872 19648 Federal Federal --_ .. __ .. 
30 090S 190E ;4304753011 19649 Federal Federal 

- --1----------
180E 14304753324 '19783 Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S State State 

Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 : 180E 14304753325 36 090S 19783 State State 
--- --

Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S '180E 4304753326 19747 State State 
Desert SI>ring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E '4304753327 119747 State State 

-- _ ... 

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E :4304753328 119783 State State 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S i 170E 4301332677 ! 15144 State State 
RBU 4-11D III 100S 180E :4304730718 16269 Federal Federal 

GW P 
--

GW P 
-~-. 

GW P 
GW P 
GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
----c------
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

--

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

-------

GW ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,P 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW iP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
-----

GW P 
GW P 

----

GW P 
---

OW P 
OW P 
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

- --
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW :S 
OW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-l l-10-18 11 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State_ GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
RBU4-llD ll 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU2-llD 
~---- --
RBU 6-llD 
STATE2-32B c--
STATE 9-36A 
FEDERAL 13-30B 
STATE 13-36A 
FEDERAL 16-26A 

II ._-- -------

II 
32 

1

36 
30 

-----~---

36 
126 

------------------+-----

FEDERAL 31-29 129 
RBU I-IOD :10 ----------------------_.- I 

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 i 18 

100S 180E 4304730826 116270 Federal Federal OW S 
------- ------ 1-------

100S 180E4304731192 16271 .Federal Federal OW S -+---- --
090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 

-090S1180E 4304732225 il1364 
---

State State IGW S 
090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
090S il80E 4304733598 17838 State State IGW S 
090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
090S ! 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
100S 1180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW .S 
090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal iGW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-l lD 11 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S
STATE 2-32B 32 '090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE 9-36A 36 _ _090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significanUy deepen existing wells below current boItom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drlH horizontal laterals. Use APPLlCA TION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for sUCh proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OILWELL 0 GAS WELL IlJ OTHER __________ _ 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Gasco Production Company 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

7979 E. Tufts Ave. 

4. LOCATIONOFWELL 

CITY Denver 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL 

STATE CO zIP80237 

QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWJIISHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S 

I PHONE NUMBER: 

(303) 483-0044 

UTU-76482 
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UMT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18 
9. API NUMBER: 

4304737631 
10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: 

Uteland Butte 

COUNTY: Uintah 

STATE: 
UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

rlI 0 ACIDIZE 0 DEEPEN 0 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(SubmH in Duplicate) 0 ALTER CASING 0 FRACTURE TREAT 0 SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work wil start: 0 CASING REPAIR 0 NEW CONSTRUCTION 0 TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

4/16/2015 0 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE 0 TUBING REPAIR 

0 CHANGE TUBING 0 PLUG AND ABANDON 0 VENT OR FLARE 

0 SUBSEQUENT REPORT 0 CHANGE WELL NAME 0 PLUG BACK 0 WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

0 CHANGE WELL STATUS 0 PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) 0 WATER SHUT-OFF 
Date of work completion: 

0 COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS 0 RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 0 OTHER: 

0 CONVERT WELL TYPE 0 RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator 01:1 this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco 
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/1612015. 

Gasco Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

Badlands Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui ~ 15 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

(512000) 

TITLE 

DATE 

(See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

RECEIVED 
JUN 0 2 2015 

DIV OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

Engineering Tech 

511812015 

APPROVE 
JAN 22 2016 

~.oIL_ GAS & MINING ... 

BY:~Ch.Jt9 rn~cLU'\~ 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-76482

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill newwells,significantlydeepen exislingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TODRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL O GASWELL OTHER Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

7979 E. Tufts Ave CITY
Denver STATE CO ZIP 80237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL COUNTY: Uintah

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FR^CTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

4/16/2015 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUGAND ABANDON O VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME O PLUGBACK O WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) O WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE O OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly show allpertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on thiswell, in additionto thewells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effectivedate of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 1
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

Michael Decker, Exec. Vi President & COO !)EC61VEL
Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui 15 JUN0 2 205
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

DIVOFOiL,GAS&MINING
Michael Decker, Exec. Vic PreWent&COO

NAME (PLEASE PRIN Lindsey Cooke TITLE Engineering Tech

SIGNATURE DATE 5/18/2015

(Thisspacefo Stateuseonly) APPROVED
JAN2 2 2016

(5/2000) (seeinstruolinsonReverseSide) IV.OlL GAS &



Well Name Section TWN RNO API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal OW DRL 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal OW OPS 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 O9OS 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee OW OPS 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S lSOE 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal OW OPS 
OATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 II OS 150E 4301332391 13787 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332447 14033 State State OW P 
OATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 II OS 150E 4301332475 14417 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 lOOS 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 II OS 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332619 15649 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 4 llOS 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332676 15242 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 lOOS l70E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 llOS 150E 4301332685 16082 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 lOOS 170E 4301332730 15243 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 llOS l70E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 llOS 160E 4301332888 15098 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333087 15S07 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 II OS 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 II OS 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 II OS 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 5-IID II lOOS 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 O9OS 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU6-2D 2 lOOS 180E 430473ll9O 7075 State State OW P 
NOC33-18J 18 O9OS 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 13-20 2 lOOS 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P 
RBU 16-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU IO-IID II lOOS 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU8-IOD 10 l00s 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 15-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 12-120 12 lOOS lSOE 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU2-IOD 10 lOOS 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-15D 15 lOOS 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-12D 12 lOOS 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE7-36A 36 O9OS 180E 4304733741 14244 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 lOOS 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734ll1 13441 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 O9OS 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 O9OS 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal OW P 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 lOOS 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE4-32B 32 O9OS 190E 4304734314 14440 State State OW P 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 lOOS 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 lOOS l70E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal OW P 
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 lOOS lSOE 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 O9OS 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal OW P 

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKINRIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 1005 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 0905 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 1908 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED l2-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE 32-08 8 110S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
RBU5-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 6-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State OW P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P
RBU 16-3D 3 1005 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 8-10D 10 1005 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 1005 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 2-l0D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-12D 12 1005 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 0905 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 0908 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal GW P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GW P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 4-32B 32 0908 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FED 14-18-2#1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FED I 1-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 0905 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW



FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee OW P 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 lOOS 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 lOOS 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 41-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304735845 14639 State State OW P 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 O9OS 190E 4304735995 14871 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 23-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736219 14738 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 21-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736220 14763 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 12-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736233 14764 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 43-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736241 14992 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 O9OS 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 33-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304737115 15011 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 O9OS 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737132 15087 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737338 15365 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO FED 21-1-10-18 I l00s 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 I lOOS 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737676 16254 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737677 15806 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304738028 16868 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal OW P 

FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 0908 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 0903 190E 4304735732 144% Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 0908 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 1005 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 0908 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 0905 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 0905 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 0905 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 0905 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 1005 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 0905 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW



LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P 
UTELAND FED 42-1 1-10-18 II 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P 
STATE21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 Slale Stale GW P 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 Slale State GW P 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P 
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P 
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P 
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State Stale GW P 
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 Slate Slale GW P 
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P 
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P 
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 Slale Stale GW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S 
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 Slale Slale OW S 
RBU 4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU2-11D II 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S 
STATE 2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 Slale State GW S 
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S 
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
RBU 1-100 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S 
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW S 

LAMBTRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 1005 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 0905 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 43047397\7 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED I 1-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 I 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert SpringsState 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
DesertSpring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
SQUAW CROSSING US 2 1005 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW S
RBU4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Fedem! Fedeml ONV S
RBU2-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304730826 16270 Fedeml Fedeml CAV S
RBU6-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304731192 16271 Fedem! Fedeml OAV S
STATE2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 0905 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW
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