
FORM APPROVED

Form 3160-3 OMBNO.1040-0136

(Julyl992} UNITED STATES SUBMITINTRIPLICATE. Expires:February28,1995

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-72634

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN NIA

TYPE OF WORK 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
DRILL U DEEPENO NIA

TYPE OF WELL 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.

O O O SINGLE MULTIPLE
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE NBE7ML-26-9-23

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Contact: Jan Nelson 9.API NUMBER:
QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. E-Mail: jan.nelson@questar.com

3. ADDRESS Telphone number 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

11002 E. 17500 S. Vernal, Ut 84078 Phone 435-781-4331 Fax 435-781-4323 NATURAL BUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*) 11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEY OR AREA

At Surface 2180' FNL 2151' FEL SWNE, SECTION 26, T9S, R23E
At proposed production zone 5 Ño§)C 2. (p0 Ô,ð0 Ÿ260 - I09 29 I SEC 26 T9S R23E Mer SLB

14. DISTANCE IN MILES FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POSTOFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARISI 13. STATE

25 + I - EAST OF OURAY, UTAH Uintah UT

15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION TO NEAREST 16.NO.OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(also to nearest drig,unit line if any) 1760 40

2151' +l-

18.DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BLMIBIA Bond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, R

8623'
ESBOOOO24

1375 + I -

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.) 22. DATE WORK WILL START 23. Estimated duration

5227 GR ASAP 10 days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certifiedby a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an exisitingbond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan Item 20 above)
3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is on National Forest System Lands' 5. Operator certification.

the SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office) 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.

SIGNED Name (printedItyped) Jan Nelson DATE April 14, 2005

TITLE Regulatory Affairs Analyst

(This space for Federal or State office use)

PERMIT NO.
~$¢ APPROVAL DATE

Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant hold any ega r equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon

CONDITIONS PPROV , IF ANY:,

BRADLEYG. HILL
APPROVED BY TITLENVIRONMENTALSCIENTISTIII DATE

*See Instructions On Reverse Side

TI 1 8.C Section 1001, makes It a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious orfraudulent statements or representations as to any mater within its jurisdiction

Div.OFOIL,GAS&MINING alof!"'"
‡e Of es'"



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
Well location, NBE #7ML-26-9-23, located as
shown in the SW 1/4 NE 1/4 of Section 26,
T9S, R23E S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, UtahSB9°59'00"W

- 2637.07' (Meas.) SB958'51"W - 26J7.54' (Meas.) '
BASIS OF ELEVATION1977 Brass Cap 1977 Brass Cap __I 1977 Brass Cop

8 High Pile
.

Ab7owM2.5 0.CHigh, Pile BENCH MARK (57 EAM) LOCATED IN THE NE 1/4 NE 1/4stones o OF SECTION 29, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE
RED WASH SE, QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5
MINUTEQUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE
UNITED STATESDEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL
SURvEY. SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 5192 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

NBE /7ML-26-9--2J
Elev. Ungraded Ground = 5233' I i 2151' N

2G1977 Brass Cap 1977 Brass Cap
0.8' High, Scattered 20' High, Pi/o ^o

Stones of Stones
- LO O 9-

--III -

SC A LE

CERTIFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTlFY THAT THE ABOVEPLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY
SUPERVISIONAND THATTHE SAME ARE UE AND CORRECTTO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND

1977 Brass Cap REGISTEREDLAND SURVEYF/ush w/ 1.0'
1977 Brass Cap A REGISTRATIONNO, 1613‡High Pile of
AB' H/gh, Scattered STATE OÝ UTAHStones 1977 Brass CaP Stones

NB954'4J"W - 2640.55' (Meas.) SB9°52'JJ"W
- 2630.73' (Meas.) UINTAH ENGINEERING & IAND SURVEYING

85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAI. UTAH 84078
LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUSNAD83) (435) 789-1017

LATITUDE= 40°00'29.53" (40.008203) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:=
90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109°17 32.82" (109.292450) 1" = 1000' 02-24-05 03-01-05

2 = PROPOSED WELLHEAD. (AUTONOMOUSNAD27) PARW
D.A. T.C. D.R.B.

REFEREG
L . PLAT-I - LATITUDE= 40°00'29.65" (40.008236)-- A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. WEATHER FILELONGITUDE= 10917'30.38" (109.291772)r-

COLD QUESTAREXPLR. &





ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
NBE 7ML-26-9-23

DRILLlNG PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth Prod. Phase Anticipated
Uinta Surface
Green River 1443' Gas
Wasatch 4343'
Mesa Verde 6173'
Buck Tongue 8523'
TD 8623'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas. Or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Oil/Gas Buck Tongue 8623'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If no flows are detected, samples
will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will
be obtained from Wonsits Valley water right #36125 or Red Wash water right # 49-2153
to supply fresh water for drilling purposes.

[!]



ONSHORE OIL & GAS Oltr)ER NO. 1 -

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
NBE 7ML-26-9-23

DRILLING PROGRAM

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 3,000 psi W.P. Double Gate BOP or Single Gate BOP (schematic attached)

B. Functional test daily

C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psi/foot or 1500 psi, (or 70% of
burst whichever is greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure
shall not exceed the internal yield pressure of the casing.

D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 3M system and individual components shall
be operable as designed.

4. Casing Program
Depth Hole Size Cse Size Type Weight

Surface 2000' 12 1/4" 9-5/8" J-55 36 lb/ft (new) LT&C
TD 8623' 7 -7/8" 4 -1/2" P-110 11.60 lb/ft (new)LT&C

*High Collapse P-110

5. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - no

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually and/or PVT/Flow Show

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Rotating Head - yes
If drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling
below 500').



ONSHORE OIL & GAS Okr]ER NO. 1 -

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
NBE 7ML-26-9-23

DRILLING PROGRAM

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will
be used. It is not intended to use oil in the mud, however, in the event it is used, oil
concentration will be less than 4% by volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 9.5
ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

6. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores - none anticipated

B. DST - none anticipated

Logging -- Mud logging -4500 to TD
GR-SP-Induction
Neutron Density
MRI

C. Formation and Completion Interval: Buck Tongue interval, final
determination Ofcompletion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation - Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.



ONSHORE OIL & GAS Olm)ER NO. 1
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
NBE 7ML-26-9-23

DRILLING PROGRAM

7. Cementing Program

Casing Volume Type & Additives

Surface l141sx Class "G" single slurry mixed to 15.6 ppg, yield = 1.19
cf/sx. Fill to surface with 160 cf (1141 sx) calculated. Tail
plug used. Allowed to set under pressure

Production Lead- 885sx* Lead/Tail oilfield type cement circulated in place .

Tail-889sx* Tail slurry: Class "G" + gilsonite and additives as
required, mixed to 14.8 ppg, yield = 1.34 cf/sx. Fill
to 5673' (±500'above top of Production Zone).

Cement Characteristics:
Lead slurry: Class "G" + extender and additives as
required, mixed to 11.0 ppg, yield = 3.82 cf/sx. Fill
to surface. Tail plug used. Allowed to set under
pressure.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and
across zones as required by the authorized officer to insure protection of natural
resources.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 3740.0 psi. Maximum
anticipated bottom hole temperature is 140° F.



ONSHORE OIL & GAS OkoER NO. 1 -

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
NBE 7ML-26-9-23

DRILLING PROGRAM

SCHEMATIC DIAGRAM OF 3,000PSI BOPSTACK

RILLING NIPPLE

-FLCW LINE

FILLUP LINE

MYORIL

BLINC RAMS

PtPE RAMS

KILL LINE CMCWE LINE

[Il



QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
NBE 7ML-26-9-23

2180' FNL 2151' FEL
SWNE SECTION 26, T9S, R23E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-72634

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI - POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

An onsite inspection was conducted for the NBE 7ML-26-9-23 on April 7, 2005. Weather conditions were
sunny and clear at the time of the onsite. In attendance at the inspection were the following individuals:

Paul Buhler Bureau of Land Management
Amy Torres Bureau of Land Management
Jan Nelson QEP Uinta Basin Inc.

1. Existinq Roads:

The proposed well site is approximately25 miles East of Ouray, Utah.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 - mile radius.

No improvements willbe made to existing access roads.

2. Planned Aceess Roads:

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

New access roads on BLM surface will be 30' in width crowned (2 to 3%), ditched, and constructed
with a running surface of 18 feet and a maximum disturbed width of 30 feet. Gravelingor capping
the road bed will be performed as necessary to provide a well constructed, safe road.

3. Location of Existinq Wells Within a 1 - Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.

4. Location of Existinq & Proposed Facilities:

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.

A containment dike will be constructed completely around those production facilities which contains
fluids (I.e., production tanks, produced water tanks). These dikes will be constructed of compacted
impervious subsoil; hold 110% of the capacity of the largest tank; and, be independent of the back
cut. If a SpillPrevention, Control,and Countermeasure (SPCC) Plan is required by the Environmental
Protection Agency, the containment dike may be expanded to meet SPCC requirements with approval
by the BLM/VFO AO. The use of topsoil of the construction of dikes will not be allowed. AII loading
lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding tank battery. AIIfacilities will be painted within six
months of installation. Facilities required to complywith the Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA)
will be excluded.

5. Location and Type of Water Supply:

Fresh water drilling fluids will be obtained from Wonsits Valley Water Right # 36125, or
Red Wash Right # 49-2153.

6. Source of Construêtion Materials:

Surface and subsurface materials in the immediate area will be utilized. Any gravel will be obtained from
a commercial source.



7. Methods of Handlinq Waste Materialç:
Drillcuttings willbe contained and buried in the reserve pit. Drilling fluids, including salts and
chemicals, will be contained in the reserve pit. Upon terminationof drilling and completion
operations, the liquid contents of the reserve pit will be used at the next drill site or will be removed
and disposed of at an approved waste disposal facility with 120 days after drillingis terminated.
Immediately upon well completion,any hydrocarbons in the pit shall be removed in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

After first production, produced wastewater will be confined to the approved pit or storage tank for
a period not to exceed 90 days. During the 90 day period, in accordance with Onshore Order #7,
all produced water will be contained in tankson location and thenhauled to Wonsits Valleylocation

in SWNW section 12, TSS, R21E; or Red Wash Disposal Well located in NESW, Section 28, T7S, R22E;
or, Red Wash Central Battery Disposal located in SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E. Pit reclamation
for lined pit will be ruptured when emptied to allowthe remaining liquid to be adequately mixed and to
promote additional drying of the pitarea.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

None anticipated.

9. Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drillpad cross-sections, cuts and fills
and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailer parking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

A pit liner is required. A felt pit liner will be required if bedrock is encountered.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Topsoil will be stripped and salvaged to provide for sufficientquantities to be respread to a depth
of at least 4 to 6 inches over the disturbed areas to be reclaimed. Topsoil shall be stock piled separately
from subsoil materials. Topsoil salvaged from the reserve pit shall be stockpiledseparately near the
reserve pit. Immediately upon well completion,the location and surroundingarea will be cleared of
all unused tubing, materials, trash, and debris not required for production. Alternatively, the pit will
be pumped dry, the liner folded into the pit, and the pit backfilled. The reserve pit will be reclaimed
within120 days from the date of wellcompletion,weather permitting.

Seed Mix: # 6

11. Surface Ownership:
Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4400

12. Other Information

A Class IIIarchaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology
Consultants. A copy of this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by
Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended
for this location.

Contact BLM before constructing low water crossing, installing culvert and high water crossing.



Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

Jan Nelson
Red Wash Rep.

QEP Uinta Basin Inc.
11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4331

Certification:

AIIlease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved

plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. will be fully responsible for the actions of theirsubcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drillwillbe furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all

construction and drilling operations.

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently

exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be

performed by QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. its' contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with thisplan and the termsand conditions under which it is approved. This statement is

subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

Ja
14-DAatre-05

Red Wash



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD FIGURE #1
e LOCABON LAYOUT FOR

NBE #7ML-26-9-23

SECTION 26, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. Approx.
Toe of

2180' FNL 2151' FEL Fill slope
lirp E- 5. 4' F- 8. 9

,'
E- 18. 4'

E/. 222.2' E/. 218.7 EL 209.2'

8

SCALE: 1" = 50' 48' Sta. J+50
DATE: 03-01-05
Drawn By D.R.B. o Round Corners

as Needed

Approx.
Top of
Cut Slope

NO7E:
Flore Pit is to be located
a min. of 100' from the
Well Head.

Pit Topsoil
PIPE TUBS

I I I I

PIPE RACKS

E/. 242.5 E/. 2JJ.1'
C-26.9' am --

(htm. pid o
j¯¯

4g' 150' Sta. 1+75

---

TOILET O E-11O'
E/. 214.6'

LIGHTPLANT

---

BOILER

o--
- COMPRESSOR WATER

u)_ PUMP HOUSE I I TANK
Il

BOOSTER

b d

H

Total P/t Volume
= 2,870 Cu. Yds. PROPANE -

B E/. 225. J'

S

C-0.4' Proposed Access E-5.4'
NOTES. E/. 228.0' Road E/. 2222'

E/ev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Stoke - 52JJ.1'
, UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

F/N/SHEO GRADE ELEV A T LOC. STAKE = 522Z 6 se s. 2oo ,,,, . v,.... 2,,, ,447, . ,,,, y,,_,o,

CONFIDENT



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROlx FIGURE #2
. TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FORX-Section

scale NBE #7ML-26-9-23

,, ,
SECTION 26, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

1 = 50 2180' FNL 2151' FEL

DATE: 03-01-05
Drown By. D.R.B.

48' 150'

Einished Grade

10' 48' 150'

Location Stoke

STA. 1+75

10' 70' 48'
150°

- CUT

STA. 0+51
IIMIN

Preconstruction 48' 150'
Grade

Slope = 1

CUT

STA. 0+00 * NOŒ•
F/LL QUANT/TY/NCLUDES
5% FOR COMPACTION

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = J,400 Cu. Yds.

CUT TOPsoil & Pit Backfill = 3,400 Cu. Yds.
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,960 Cu. Yds- (1/2 Pit Vol.)
Rernaining Location = 1J,140Cu. Yds. EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 15,100 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)

FILL = 11,700 CU.YDS. ÏIINTAH ENGINEERING & I,AND SURVEYING
85 So, ß00 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435) 789-1017





QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
NBE #7ML-26-9-23

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 26, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

N STAKE

CORNER #5

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHEASTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHERLY

y, Cintah Engineering & Land Surveying l-OCATION PHOTos 03 0 1 05 vuoro
85 South 200 East Vemal. Utah 84078 10NTI Du YEAR

s,a,.e en 4 435 789-1017 uels wuelsine.com | TAKENBY:D.A. DRAWNBY:L.K. YlSED:00-00-00





WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 04/19/2005 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-36587

WELL NAME: NBE 7ML-26-9-23

OPERATOR: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. ( N2460 )

CONTACT: JAN NELSON PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4331

PROPOSED LOCATION:

SWNE 26 090S 230E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SURFACE: 2180 FNL 2151 FEL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 2180 FNL 2151 FEL

UINTAH Engineering

NATURAL BUTTES ( 630 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface
LEASE NUMBER: UTU-72634

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal
LATITUDE: 40.00825

PROPOSED FORMATION: MVRD

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.2918

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3.

Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit

(No. ESBOOOO24 )
Potash (Y/N) */ R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 49-2153 )
Drilling Unit

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:(Date: )
Eff Date:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS:



T4'i FT3f

CWU3

cwu10

NGC1<-26 24

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD

NBE g
NBE y MIL žçon NBE

2ML-26 B NBE
. CAT)Sie 179-8 4ML-26-9-D 1ML-2 9 25

NBEg
11ML-26·5-25

NBE a
15ML-26 9 23

SOUTHMANg
CYN3·36 U SOUlllMAN

SOUTHMAN
(YN 2D-360-

CYN 4 3&&

SOUTHMAN 50--

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT "$ 50LWIMAN

CYN7-3½23

CYN 6D-36 m

36
SOUTHMANCYN SOUTHMAN

CWU 54&& ( S CHAPITA S CHAPITA 11-169 Ug CYN IDD 36

1 2
12·35 g SOUTHMAN CYN 12D-36

SCHAPITA
CWU st11aPITA SOUTHMAN11-35 g S CYN 15 25

(w sa W SOUTHMAN
CYN MC-36

I

OPERATOR- QEP UINTA BASIN INC (N2460)

SEC. 26 T.9S R.23E

FIELD: NATURAL BUTTES (630)

COUNTY:UINTAH

.veSPACING:R669-3-2/GENERALS Gruhr

Fields.shp UtahOilGas and Mining
A GASINjECTlON EXPLORATORY ABANDONED
a GASSTORAGE GASSTORAGE ACTIVE
× LOCATION ABANDONED

NEW LOCATION
NF PP OIL COMBINED

+ PLUGGED & ABANDONED NF SECONDARY INACTIVE

A PRODUCING GAS PENDING PROPOSED
$ PRODUCINGOR P1OfL STORAGE

SHUT-IN GAS PP GAS TERMINATED
• SHUT-IN OIL
M TEMP. ABANDONED PP GEOTHERML 5

TEST WELL PP OIL

s WATER INJECTION SECONDARY

• WATER SUPPLY TERMINATED FREPARED BY:DIANA WHITNEY

cr WATER DISPOSAL DATE



0 0 5
JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah April 20, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.

11002 E 17500 S
Division of Vernal, UT 84078

Oil, Gas & Mining

MARY ANN WRIGHT
Acting Division Director Re: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Well, 2180' FNL, 215 l' FEL, SW NE, Sec. 26, T. 9 South,

R. 23 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36587.

S°
ely,

J hn R. Baza
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801)538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458



Operator: QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Well Name & Number NBE 7ML-26-9-23

API Number: 43-047-36587
Lease: UTU-72634

Location: SW NE Sec. 26 T. 9 South R. 23 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the



FORM APPROVED

Form 3160-3 OMB NO. 1040-0136

(July1992) UNITEDSTATES SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE, Expires:February28,1995

DEPARTMENT 0F THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-72634

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN NIA

TYPE OF WORK 7. UNITAGREEMENT NAME

DRILL U DEEPENO NIA

TYPE OF WELL 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.

O O SINGLE MULTIPLE
O

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE NBE7ML-26-9-23

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Contact: Jan Nelson 9.API NUMBER:

QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. E-Mail: jan.nelson@questar.com /

3. ADDRESS Telphone number 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WTLDCAT

11002 E. 17500 S. Vernal, Ut 84078 Phone 435-781-4331 Fax 435-781-4323 NATURAL BUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*) 11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEY OR AREA

At Surface 2180' FNL 2151' FEL SWNE, SECTION 26, T9S, R23E

At proposed production zone SEC 26 T9S R23E Mer SLB

14. DISTANCE IN MILES FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POSTOFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARIS 13. STATE

25 + / - EAST OF OURAY, UTAH Uintah UT

15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION TO NEAREST 16.NO.OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(also to nearest drig,unit line if any) 1760 40

2151' +/-

18.DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BLMIBIA Bond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, ft

8623'
ESBOOOO24

1375 + I -

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.) 22. DATE WORK WILL START 23. Estimated duration

522T GR ASAP 10 days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1.Wellplat certifiedby a registered surveyor. 4. Bondto cover the operations unless covered by an exisitingbond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan Item 20 above).
3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is on National Forest System Lands' 5. Operator certification.

the SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office) 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized officer.

DECEIVED
SIGNED Name (printedItyped) Jan Nelson DATE April 14, 2005

TITLE Regulatory Affairs Analyst [ () A
(This space for Federal or State office use)

PERMITNO. APPROVAL DATE

Ap atio se rights in the subject le w dFe he app uct operations thereon

*See Instructions On Reverse Sicle

T e .S.C ection 1001, makes it a crime forany person knowingly and willfullyto make to any department or agency of



COAs Page 1 of 5
Well No.: NBE 7ML-26-9-23

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

CompanylOperator: QEP Uintah Basin Inc.

Well Name & Number: NBE 7ML-26-9-23

API Number: 43-047-36587

Lease Number: U-72634

Location: SWNE Sec. _2_6_ T..9.S.R. 23E

Agreement: N/A

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval
for Notice to Drilland Surface Use Program.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR NOTICE TO DRILL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certifythat the applicant holds legal or equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well is
being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

Report U water shows and water-bearing sands to John Mayers of this office prior to setting
the next casing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies of State of Utah form
OGC-8-Xare acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected, submit samples to thisoffice
along withany water analyses conducted.

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to determine
commercial
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Well No.: NBE 7ML-26-9-23

Pressure Control Equipment

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimumrequirements of Onshore Oil and Gas
Order No. 2 for equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc., for a 3M system and
individual components shall be operable as designed. Chart recorders shall be used for all
pressure tests.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while drilling
and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

Ifan air compressor is on location and is being utilized to provide air for the drilling medium
while drilling, the special drilling requirements in Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2, regarding air
or gas drilling shall be adhered to.

Casinq Program and Auxiliary Equipment

Surface casing shall have centralizers on the bottom three joints, with a minimumof one
centralizer per joint. Surface casing setting depths are based on ground level elevations only.

Corinq, Loqqinq and Testinq Program

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to this office on a weekly basis.

A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to top of the cement and
shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of
the CBL to thisoffice.

Please submit an electronic copy of all logs run on this well in LAS format. This
submission will supersede the requirement for submittal of paper logs to the BLM. The
cement bond log must be submitted in raster format (TIF, PDF or other).

Whether thewell is completedas a dry hole or as a producer, "WellCompletion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30 days after
completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43
CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data, geologic
summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the
drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, will be filed with Form 3160-4. Samples
(cuttings, fluids, and/or gases) will be submitted when requested by the AO.

Notifications of Operations

No location will be constructed or moved, no wellwillbe plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior approval
of the AO. Ifoperations are to be suspended, prior approval of the AO will be obtained and
notification given before resumption of operations.

Operator shall report production data to MMS pursuant to 30 CFR 216.5 using form MMS/3160.

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual
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Well No.: NBE 7ML-26-9-23

shall be promptly reported in accordance with the requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

Ifa replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "Sundry Notice" (Form 3160-5)
to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved plan
are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.

The date on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for oil wells as the
date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporarystorage facility,
such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or, the date on which
liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent storage facility, whichever first occurs;
and, for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped
from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be
generated or, the date on which gas is first measured throughpermanent metering facilities,
whichever first occurs.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO willbe notifiedwhen the well
is placed in a producing status. Written notificationof such must be submitted to this office not
later than five (5) days following the date on which the well is placed on production.

Gas produced from this well may not be vented or flared beyond an initial authorized test period
of 30 days or 50 MMCF following its completion, whichever occurs first, without the prior written
approval of the Authorized Officer. Should gas be vented or flared without approval beyond the
authorized test period, the operator may be directed to shut-in the well untilthe gas can be
captured or approval to continue venting or flaring as uneconomic is granted and the operator
shall be required to compensate the lessor for that portion of the gas vented or flared without
approval which is determined to have been avoidably lost.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5(d) shall be submitted to the
appropriate Field Office within 60 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs first.
All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be adhered to.
All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectivelysealed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (1).

No well abandonment operations willbe commenced without the prior approval of the AO. In
the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergencies, oral approval will be obtained
from the AO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be filed with the AO
within thirty (30) days following completion of the well for abandonment. This report will indicate
where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Final abandonment will
not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by the approved APD or approved
abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his representative, or
the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.

Other Information

The use of materials under BLMjurisdictionwillconform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover program without prior
approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Allwells,
whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned will be identified in accordance with
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CFR 3162.

"Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for approval for all changes of
plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Michael Lee (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435)
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Well No.: NBE 7ML-26-9-23

Company/Operator: QEP, Uinta Basin, Inc

API Number 43-047-36587

Well Name & Number 7ML-26-9-23

Lease number: U-72634

Location: SWNE Sec, _26, T.9S. R. 23E.

Surface Ownership: BLM

Date NOS Received: 3/16/05

Date APD Received: 4/18/05

Conditions for Approval are in the



Onll

PROPOSED LOCATION:
IIE #7ML-26 23

2E3

LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
pf oisrosALwEi.is WATER WELLS N NBE #7ML-26-9-23
e PRODL CING WELI S ABANDONED WELLS SECTION 26, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.& M.

SHLITINWELLS TEMPORARILYABANDONED 2180' FNL 2151' FEL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A P Il le 03 01 05
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 1 A MONTH DAY VEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1"= 2000' DRAWNBY:LK. REVISED:00-00-00

O



PROPOSED LOCATION
NBE #7ML-26-9-23

6

M PROPOSED PIPELINE

S 04

E #8ML-26

APPROXIMATE TOTAL PIPELINE DISTANCE = 350' +/-

LEGEND: OUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD N NBE #7ML-26-9-23

---------- EXISTINGPIPELINE SECTION 26, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
---·--------- PROPOSED PIPEI INE

2180' FNL 2151' FEL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 03 01 05
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P MONTH DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1" = 1000'. DRAWNBY:L.K. .REVISED:00-00·00



[0CONRDENTW.
STATEOFUTAH FORM9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATlONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU-72634

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F NDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRlBENAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do notuse this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to N/Adrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER NBE 7ML-26-9-23

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APlNUMBER:

QEP UINTABASIN, INC 4304736587
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL STATE UT 7,,84078 (435) 781-4331 NATURAL BUTTES
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2180 FNL 2151 FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNE 26 9S 23E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATlON
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASlNG FRACTURE TREAT SlDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTlON TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCT10N (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: APD EXTENSION

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. hereby requests a 1 year extension on the NBE 7ML-26-9-23

NAME(PLEASE P INT) Jan Nelson TITLE Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE
( T

DATE 4/5/2006

(ThisspaceforSta useonly) RECENED

APR1O2006
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side) DN.OF0\L,GAS&



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-36587
Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23

Location: 2180 FNL 2151 FEL, SWNE, SEC. 26 T9S R23E.
Company Permit Issued to: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
Date Original Permit Issued: 4/20/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes O NoO

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO Nom

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesO NolZl

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesO No O

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged? YesO No2

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which will require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesO NoO

Is bo ding still in place, which covers thisproposed well? YesŒNoO

4/5/2006

Si at re Date

T le: REGULATORY AFFAIRS

Representing: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. RECENED

Apgi O2006

Og OF0\L,GAS&



Form3160-5 UNITED STATES RE EVF FORMAPPROVED
am., , OMB No. 1004-0135

(November 1994) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires July 31, 1996

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-72634
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
N/A
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No,

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side N/A
1. Type of Well

Oil Well O Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator NBE 7ML-26-9-23

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Contact: Jan Nelson 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36587

11002 East 17500 South, Vernal, UT 84078 435-781-4331 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) NATU RAL BUTTES
2180' FNL 2151' FEL S1/VNE,SECTION 26, T9S, R23E l l. County or Parish, State

Uintah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

O Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon APD EXTENSION

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly stale all perlinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or roomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and meamred and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones

Attach the Bond under which the work will be perf<rmed or provide the Bond Na on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reporis shall be filed within 30 days

Following conpletion of the involved operations If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

Testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requimments, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site isrcady for final inspection.)

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., hereby requests a 1 year extension on the APD for the NBE 7ML-26-9-23.

BLM APD approv 5.

Accapied by Rayah DMalon aOil, Gas and Amy

FORRECORDONLY

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Jan Nelson Regulatory Affairs
Signature De

31, 2006
THIS SPACE FOATEBERAL-ORST"ATE USE

Approved by Title Date

DENIED
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify Office

that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would

entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States any false, fictitious or

fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

n r

MN



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-36587

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23

Location: 2180' FNL 2151' FEL SWNE SEC. 26 T9S R23E
Company Permit Issued to: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
Date Original Permit Issued: 7/19/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Followinq is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes O NoIZI

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO NolZl

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesO NoIZI

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesO No IZl

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged? YesO No1ZI

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesO NoIZI

Is bo I g still in place, which covers this proposed well? YeslZINoO

7/31/2006

Si nature Date

Title: REGULATORY AFFAIRS

Representing: QEP UINTA BASIN,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-QuestarE&P Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900

CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED LISTS *

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/31/2005

4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143

5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a

5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 4/23/2007 BIA
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 4/23/2007
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.
SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xls 4/30/2007 AND



1 of 8 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

FEDERAL 2-29-7-22 FEDERAL 2-29-7-22 NESW 29 070S 220E 4304715423 5266 Federal GW S
UTAH FED D-1 UTAH FED D-1 SWSW 14 070S 240E 4304715936 10699 Federal GW IS
UTAH FED D-2 .UTAH FED D-2 NESW · 25 070S 240E 4304715937 9295 Federal GW S
PIUT4CE 1 IPRlflCE 1 SVVSIV 10 070S 240E 4304716199 7035 Fedenal GAV P
UTAH FED D-4 _ _ |UTAH FED D-4 SWSE 14 070S 240E 4304731215 9297 Federal GW S
FZ BB 1 IBRENNAN FZ-BB1 NESE : 20 070S 210E 4304731805 10952 Federal GW TA
EAST COYOTE FED 14-4-8-25 iEAST COYOTE FED 14-4-8-25 SESW 04 080S 250E 4304732493 11630 Federal OW IP
FSPTUTICE4 PIUf9CE4 SVVSTV 03 070S 240E 4304732677 7035 Fedend CON P
GYPSUM HILLS 21 GH 21 WG SWSW 21 080S 210E 4304732692 11819 Federal GW P
SAGE GROUSE FED 6-14-8-22 OU SG 6 14 8 22 SENW 14 080S 220E 4304732746 11944 Federal |GW P
GYPSUM HILLS 22WG GH 22 WG SWNW 22 080S 210E 4304732818 12336 Federal GW P
SAGE GROUSE 12A-14-8-22 SAGE GROUSE 12A-14-8-22 iNWSW 14 0808 220E 4304733177 12524 Federal GW S
OU GB 12W-20-8-22 OU GB 12W-20-8-22 NWSW 20 0808 ž20E 4304733249 13488 Federal GW P
GBU 15-18-8-22 'OU GB 15 18 8 22 SWSE 18 080S 220E 4304Ÿ33364 12690 Federal GW P
GLEN BENCH FED 3W-17-8-22 OU GB 3W 17 8 22 NENW 17 080S 220E 4304733513 12950 Federal iGW P
GLEN BENCH FED 5W-17-8-22 OU GB SW 17 8 22 SWNW 17 080S 220E 4304733514 12873 Federal GW P
WV FED 9W-8-8-22 WV 9W 8 8 22 NESE 08 | 080S 220E 4304733515 13395 I GW P
GB FED 9W-18-8-22 OU GB 9W 18 8 22 NESE 18 | 080S 220E 4304733516 12997 Federal |GW P
OU GB 3W-20-8-22 OU GB 3W-20-8-22 NENW 20 I 080S 220E 4304733526 13514 Federal GW P
GLEN BENCH_l2W-30-8-22 OU GB 12W 30 8 22_ NWSW 30 080S 220E 4304733670 | 13380 Federal GW P
WVFU 10W-8-8-22 WV 10W 8 8 22 NWSE 08 080S 220E 4304733814 | 13450 Federal GW P
GH71V-21-8-21 GFI79V-21-8-21 SUV>U 21 080S 210E i 4304733845 13050 Federal G'N P
GH 9W-21-8-21 GH 9W-21-8-21 NESE 21 080S 210E 4304733846 13074 Federal GW P
GH 11W-21-8-21 GH 11W-21-8-21 NESW 21 080S 210E 4304733847 13049 Federal GW P
GH 15W-21-8-21 GH 15W-21-8-21 SWSE 21 080S 210E 4304733848 13051 Federal GW P
WV 7W-22-8-21 WV 7W-22-8-21 SWNE 22 080S | 210E 4304733907 13230 Federal GW P
WV 9W-23-8-21 WV 9W-23-8-21 NESE 23 080S 210E 4304733909 13160 Federal GW P
GHU 14W-20-8-21 GH 14W 20 8 21 SESW 20 080S 210E 4304733915 13073 Federal GW P
GB 4W-30-8-22 OU GB 4W 30 8 22 NWNW 30 080S 220E 4304733945 13372 Federal GW P
GB 9W-19-8-22 OU GB 9W 19 8 22 NESE 19 080S 220E 4304733946 13393 Federal GW P
GB 10W-30-8-22 OU GB 10W 30 8 22 NWSE 30 i 080S ' 220E 4304733947 13389 Federal . GW P
GB 12Ÿl9-8-22 OU GB 12W 19 8 2_2 _ NWSW 19 | 080S . 220E 4304733948 13388 FederaÏ _'GW P
GB 9W-25-8-21 GB 9W-25-8-21 NESE 25 080S 210E 4304733960 13390 Federal GW P
WV 1W-5-8-22 SU 1W 5 8 22 NENE 05 080S 220E 4304733985 13369 Federal GW P
WV 3W-5-8-22 SU 3W 5 8 22 |NENW 05 080S 220E 4304733987 13321 Federal OW S
WV 7W-5-8-22 SU 7W 5 8 22 SWNE 05 080S 220E 4304733988 13235 Federal iGW iP
WV 9W-5-8-22 SU 9W 5 8 22 'NESE 05 080S 220E 4304733990 i 13238 Federal GW P
TVV llM'-5-8-22 SUl19V5822 NESTV i 05 080S 220E 4304733992 13239 Federal Giv S
WV 13W-5-8-22 SU 13W 5 8 22 SWSW 05 080S 220E ' 4304733994 13236 Fe ral GW S
WV 15W-5-8-22 SU 15W 5 8 22 : SWSE 05 080S 220E 4304733996 13240 Federal GW P
WV 8W-8-8-22 WV 8W-8-8-22 |SENE 08 080S 220E 4304734005 13320 Federal GW P
WV 14W-8-8-22 WV 14W-8-8-22 SESW 08 i 080S 220E 4304734007 13322 Federal W



2 of 8 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

Original Well Name NO Q/Q SEC i TWP | RNG API ntity Lease Well Type Status

OU GB 6W-20-8-22 |OU GB 6W-20-8-22 SENW 20 080S 220E 4304734018 13518 Federal GW P
GB 5W-30-8-22 OU GB SW 30 8 22 SWNW 30 080S 220E 4304734025 13502 Federal GW P
GB 11W-20-8-22 OU GB 11W 20 8 22 INESW 20 080S 220E 4304734039 13413 Federal GW P
OU GB 4W-20-8-22 OU GB 4W-20-8-22 INWNW 20 080S 220E 4304734043 13520 Federal GW P
GH 5W-21-8-21 GH 5W-21-8-21 SWNW 21 080S 210E 4304734147 13387 Federal GW P
GH 6W-21-8-21 _ GH 6W-21-8-21 |SENW 21 080S_ 210E 4304734148 13371 Federal GW P
GH 8W-21-8-21 GH 8W-21-8-21 ISENE 21 080S 210E 4304734149 13293 Federal GW P
GH 10W-20-8-21 GH 10W-20-8-21 NWSE 20 080S 210E 4304734151 13328 Federal GW P
GH 10W-21-8-21 GH 10W-21-8-21 NWSE 21 080S 210E 4304734|52 13378 Federal GW P
GH 12W-21-8-21 GH 12W-21-8-21 NWSW 21 080S 210E 4304734153 13294 Federal GW P
GH 14W-21-8-21 GH 14W-21-8-21 :SESW 21 080S 210E 4304734154 13292 Federal ;GW P
GH 16W-21-8-21 GH 16W-21-8-21 SESE 21 080S 210E 4304734157 i 13329 Federal |GW P
GB 5W-20-8-22 OU GB 5W 20 8 22 SWNW 20 080S 220E 4304734209 13414 Federal GW P
WV 6W-22-8-21 WV 6W-22-8-21 ISENW 22 080S 210E 4304734272 13379 Federal GW P
GH IW-20-8-21 GH 1W-20-8-21 NENE 20 080S 210E 4304734327 13451 Federal GW P
GH 2W-20-8-21 GH 2W-20-8-21 ÑWNE 20 080S 210E 4304734328 13527 Federal GW P
GH 3W-20-8-21 GH 3W-20-8-21 NENW 20 080S 210E 4304734329 13728 Federal GW P
GH 7W-20-8-21 GH 7W-20-8-21 SWNE 20 ' 080S 210E : 4304734332 13537 Federal GW P
GH 9W-20-8-21 GH 9W-20-8-21 NESE 20 080S 210E . 4304734333 13411 Federal GW P
GH 11W-20-8-21 GH llW-20-8-21 NESW 20 080S 210E 4304734334 13410 Federal GW P
GH 15W-20-8-21 GH 15W-20-8-21 SWSE 20 080S 210E 4304734335 13407 Federal GW P
GH 16W-20-8-21 GH 16W-20-8-21 SESE 20 080S 210E 4304734336 13501 Federal GW P
WV 12W-23-8-21 WV 12W-23-8-21 NWSW 23 080S 210E 43047343Ã313430 Federal GW PÕÏÏ¯B

13W-20-8-22 OU GB 13W-20-8-22 SWSW 20 080S 220E 4304734348 13495 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-20-8-22 OU GB 14W-20-8-22 SESW 20 080S 220E 4304734349 13507 Federal GW _)P
OU GB 11W-29-8-22 OU GB 11W-29-8-22 NESW 29 080S 220E 4304734350 13526 Federal GW P
WV 11G-5-8-22 WVX 11G 5 8 22 NESW 05 080S 220E 4304734388 13422 Federal OW P
WV 13G-5-8-22 _ _ WVX 13G 5 8 22 SWSW 05 I 080S 220E 4304734389 13738 Federal OW ,P
WV 15G-5-8-22 WVX 15G 5 8 22 SWSE 05 080S 220E 4304734390 13459 Federal OW |P
SU BRENNAN W 15W-18-7-22 SU BRENNAN W 15W-18-7-22 SWSE 18 070S ; 220E : 4304734403 13442 Federal GW ITA

STIRRUP U 16W-5-8-22 SU16W 5 8 22 SESE 05 ' 080S 220E 4304734446 13654 Federal GW 'P
STIRRUP U 2W-5-8-22 SU 2W 5 8 22 NWNE 05 080S 220E . 4304734455 13700 Federal GW P
WV 10W-5-8-22 SU10W 5 8 22 NWSE 05 , 080S 220E 4304734456 13540 Federal GW P
WV 16W-8-8-22 WV 16W-8-8-22 SESE 08 , 080S 220E 4304734470 13508 Federal GW P
GB 16WX-30 822 OU GB16WX 30 8 22 SESE 30 080S 220E 4304Ñ50 13431 Federal GW P
OU GB 1W-19-8-22 OU GB 1W-19-8-22 NENE 19 080S 220E 4304734512 13469 :Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-19-8-22 OU GB 2W-l9-8-22 NWNE , 19 0808 220E 4304734513 13461 Federal iGW P
OU GB 5W-19-8-22 OU GB 5W-19-8-22 SWNW 19 080S 220E 4304734514 13460 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-19-8-22 OU GB 7W-19-8-22 SWNE 6 19 0808 220E 4304734515 13462 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-19-8-22 OU GB 8W-19-8-22 SENE 19 0808 220E 4304734516 13489 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-19-8-22 OU GB 11W-19-8-22 NESW : 19 0808 220E 4304734517 13467 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-19-8-22 OU GB 16W-19-8-22 SESE 19 080S 220E 4304734522 13476 Federal GW



of 8 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

Original Well Name Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

GB 1W-30-8-22 OU GB 1W 30 8 22 NENE 30 Í 080S i 220Ë 4304734528 13487 Federal GW P
GB 3W-30-8-22 OU GB 3W 30 8 22 NENW 30 i 080S i 220E 4304734529 13493 Federal GW P
GB 6W-30-8-22 OU GB 6W 30 8 22 SENW 30 1 080S i 220E 4304734530 13519 Federal GW P
GB 7W-30-8-22 OU GB 7W 30 8 22 SMWE i 30 080S : 220E 4304734531 13494 Federal GW P
GB 8W-30-8-22 OU GB 8W 30 8 22 SENE 30 080S 220E 4304734532 13483 Federal GW P
GB 9W-30-8-22 OU GB 9W 30 8 22 NESE | 30 080S 220E 4304734533 13500 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-19-8-22 OU GB 6W-19-8-22 SENW 19 080S 220E 4304734534 13475 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-19-8-22 OU GB 10W-19-8-22 NWSE 19 080S 220E 4304734535 13479 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-19-8-22 ;OU GB 13W-19-8-22 SWSW 19 080S 220E 4304734536 13478 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-19-8-22 |OU GB 14W-19-8-22 SESW 19 080S 220E 4304734537 13484 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-19-8-22 |OU GB 15W-19-8-22 SWSE 19 080S 220E 4304734538 13482 Federal GW P
OU GB 12W-17-8-22 OU GB 12W-17-8-22 NWSW 17 080S = 220E 4304734542 13543 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-17-8-22 OU GB 6W-17-8-22 SENW 17 080S 220E 4304734543 13536 Federal IGW P
OU GB 13W-17-8-22 OU GB 13W-17-8-22 SWSW 17 : 080S : 220E 4304734544 13547 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-29-8-22 OU GB 6W-29-8-22 SENW 29 i 080S 220E 4304734545 13535 Federal GW P
OU GB 3W-29-8-22 OU GB 3W-29-8-22 NENW 29 080S 220E 4304734546 13509 Federal .GW P
OU GB 13W-29-8-22 OU GB 13W-29-8-22 SWSW 29 0808 220E 4304734547 13506 Federal GW iP
OU GB 4W-29-8-22 OU GB 4W-29-8-22 NWNW 29 080S 220E 4304734548 13534 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-29-8-22 OU GB 5W-29-8-22 SWNW 29 080S 220E 4304734549 13505 Federal GW i
OU GB 14W-17-8-22 OU GB 14W-17-8-22 SESW 17 0808 220E 4304734550 l_355_0 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-17-8-22 OU GB llW-17-8-22 NESW 17 0808 220E 4304734553 13671 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-29-8-22 OU GB 14W-29-8-22 SESW 29 080S 220E 4304734554 13528 Federal iGW P
OU GB 2W-17-8-22 ;OU GB 2W-17-8-22 NWNE 17 0808 220E 4304734559 13539 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-17-8-22 IOU GB 7W-17-8-22 SWNE 17 080S 220E 4304734560 13599 Federal |GW P
OU GB 16W-18-8-22 [OU GB 16W-18-8-22 SESE 18 080S 220E 4304734563 13559 Federal GW P
OU GB 1W-29-8-22 'OU GB 1W-29-8-22 NENE 29 0808 220E 4304734573 13562 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-29-8-22 OU GB 7W-29-8-22 SWNE 29 0808 220E 4304734574 13564 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-29-8-22 OU GB BW-29-8-22 SENE 29 0808 220E 4304734575 13609 Federal GW S
OU GB 9W-29-8-22 OU GB 9W-29-8-22 NESE 29 0808 220E 4304734576 13551 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-29-8-22 OU GB 10W-29-8-22 NWSE 29 080S 220E 4304734577 i 13594 Fieral GW P
OU GB 15W-29-8-22 OU GB 15W-29-8-22 SWSE 29 080S 220E 4304734578 13569 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-20-8-22 iOU GB 2W-20-8-22 NWNE 20 080S 220E 4304734599 13664

,
Federal GW P

OU GB 2W-29-8-22 iOU GB 2W-29-8-22 NWNE 29 080S 220E 4304734600 13691 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-17-8-22 OU GB 15W-17-8-22 SWSE 17 080S 220E 4304734601 13632 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-17-8-22 OU GB 16W-17-8-22 SESE 17 080S 220E 4304734602 i 3639 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-29-8-22 OU GB 16W-29-8-22 SESE 29 080S 220E 4304734603 13610 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-20-8-22 OU GB 1W-20-8-22 NENE 20 080S 220E 4304734604 13612 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-17-8-22 OU GB 1W-17-8-22 NENE 17 080S 220E 4304734623 13701 Federal GW P
ÕU GB 9W-17-8-22 OU GB 9W-17-8-22 NESE 17 080S 220E 4304734624 13663 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-17-8-22 OU GB 10W-17-8-22 NWSE 17 080S 220E 4304734625 13684 Federal GW P
OU GB 9W-20-8-22 OU GB 9W-20-8-22 NESE 20 080S 220E 4304734630 13637 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-20-8-22 |OU GB 10W-20-8-22 iNWSE 20 080S 220E 4304734631 13682 Federal GW



4 of 8 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

OU GB 15W-20-8-22 OU GB 15W-20-8-22 SWSE 20 080S 220E 4304734632 13613 Federal GW P
WIH 15MU-21-8-22 OU WIH 15MU 218 22 SWSE - 21 080S 220E 4304734634 13991 Federal GW P
OU WIH 13W-21-8-22 OU WIH 13W-21-8-22 SWSW 21 080S 220E 4304734646 13745 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-15-8-22 OU GB 11W-15-8-22 NESW 15 080S 220E 4304734648 | 13822 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-9-8-22 OU GB 13W-9-8-22 SWSW 09 080S 220E 4304734654 13706 |Federal GW P
OU WIH 14W-21-8-22 OU WIH 14W-21-8-22 SESW 21 080S 220E 4304734664 | 13720 |Federal GW P
OU GB 12WX-29-8-22 OU GB 12WX-29-8-22 NWSW 29 080S 220E 4304734668 | 13555 IFederal GW P
OU WIH 10W-21-8-22 OU WIH 10W-21-8-22 NWSE 21 080S 220E 4304734681 13662 Federal GW P
ÕU GB 4G-21-8-22 OU GB 4G-21-8-22 NWNW 21 080S 220E 4304734685 13772 Federal OW P
OU GB 3W-21-8-22 OU GB 3W-21-8-22 .NENW 21 080S 220E 4304734686 I 13746 Federal GW P
OU GB 16SG-30-8-22 OU GB 16SG-30-8-22 SESE 30 080S 220E 4304734688 13593 Federal GW S
OU WIH 7W-21-8-22 OU WIH 7W-21-8-22 SWNE 21 080S 220E 430473468

137Ï
F̄ederal GW P

OU GB 5W-21-8-22 OU GB 5W-21-8-22 SWNW 21 080S 220E 4304734690 13770 Federal GW P
WlH 1MU-21-8-22 WIH 1MU-21-8-22 NENE 21 080S 220E 4304734693 14001 Federal GW P
OU GB SG-19-8-22 OU GB 5G-19-8-22 SWNW 19 080S 220E 4304734695 13786 Federal OW P
OU GB 7W-20-8-22 OU GB 7W-20-8-22 SWNE 20 080S 220E 4304734705 I3710 Federal GW P
ÜÜSG 14W-15-8-22 OU SG 14W-15-8-22 _ SESW 15 0805 | 220E 430 ‡754710

13Š2Ï¯
Federal GW P

OU SG 15W-15-8-22 OU SG 15W-15-8-22 SWSE 15 080S 220E 430473471I 13790 Federal GW P
OU SG 16W-1 Ì-8-22 OU SG 16W-15-8-22 SESE 15 080S 220E 4304734712 13820 Federal GW P
OU SG 4W-15-8-22 OU SG 4W-15-8-22 NWNW 15 080S 220E 4304734713 13775 Federal GW P
OU SG 12W-15-8-22 OU SG 12W-15-8-22 NWSW 15 080S 220E 4304734714 13838 Federal GW P
OU GB SMU-15-8-22 OU GB 5MU-15-8-22 SWNW 15 080S . 220E 4304734715 13900 Federal GW P
OU SG 8W-15-8-22 OU SG 8W-15-8-22 SENE 15 080S 220E 4304734717 13819 Federal GW P
OU SG 9W-15-8-22 OU SG 9W-15-8-22 NESE 15 | 080S 220E 4304734718 13773 Federal GW P
OU SG 10W-15-8-22 OU SG 10W-15-8-22 NWSE 15 ( 080S 220E 4304734719 13722 Federal GW P
OU SG 2MU-15-8-22 OU SG 2MU-15-8-22 NWNE 15 ' 080S 220E 4304734721 13887 Federal GW P
OU SG 7W-15-8-22 OU SG 7W-15-8-22 SWNE 15 080S 220E 4304734722 13920 Federal GW P
OU GB 14SG-29-8-22 OU GB 14SG-29-8-22 SESW 29 080S 220E 4304734743 14034 Federal GW P
OU GB 16SG-29-8-22 OU GB 16SG-29-8-22 SESE 29 080S 220E 4304734744 13771 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-10-8-22 OU GB 13W-10-8-22 SWSW 10 I 080S 220E 4304734754 13774 Federal GW P
OU GB 6MU-21-8-22 OU GB 6MU-2 l-8-22 SENW 21 080S 220E 4304734755 14012 Federal GW P
OU SG 10W-10-8-22 OU SG 10W-10-8-22 NWSE 10 080S 220E 4304734764 13751 Federal GW P
OU GB 14M-10-8-22 OU GB 14M-10-8-22 SESW 10 080S 220E 4304734768 13849 |Federal GW P
OU SG 9W-10-8-22 OU SG 9W-10-8-22 NESE 10 080S 220E 4304734783 13725 'Federal GW P
OU SG 16W-10-8-22 OU SG 16W-10-8-22 SESE - 10 080S 220E 4304734784 13781 Federal GW P
GB 3M-27-8-21 GB 3M-27-8-21 NENW 27 080S 210E 4304734900 14614 Federal GW P
WVX 11D-22-8-21 WVX 11D-22-8-21 NESW 22 OSOS 210E 4304734902 14632 Federal GW IDRL
GB 11M-27-8-21

¯
GB llM-27-8-21 NESW i 27 0808 210E 4304734952 13809 Federal GW P

GB 9D-27-8-21 GB 9D-27-8-21 NESE 27 0808 210E 4304734956 14633 iFederal GW DRL
GB 1D-27-8-21 GB 1D-27-8-21 _ NENE 27 080S 210E 4304734957 14634

Federal¯
GW DRL

WRU EIH 2M-35-8-22 _ WRU EIH 2M-35-8-22 NWNE 35 080S 220E 4304735052 13931 Federal GW ,P
GYPSUM HILLS 12MU-20-8-21 GH 12MU20 8 21 NWSW 20 080S 210E 4304735069 14129 Federal GW



5 of 8 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP ' RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

OU SG 4W-11-8-22 OU SG 4W-11-8-22 NWNW 11 0Š0Š 220E 4304735071 14814 Federal GW DRL
OU SG 5W-11-8-22 OU SG 5W-11-8-22 SWNW 11 080S 220E 4304735072 14815 Federal GW DRL
OU SG 6W-11-8-22 SG 6ML 11 8 22 SENW 11 080S 220E 4304735073 14825 Federal GW P
OU SG SMU-14-8-22 'OU SG 5MU-14-8-22 SWNW 14 080S 220E 4304735076 13989 Federal GW P
OU SG 6MU-14-8-22 IOU SG 6MU-14-8-22 SENW 14 080S 220E 4304735077 14128 Federal GW P
SG 12MU-14-8-22 ISG 12MU-14-8-22 NWSW 14 080S 220E 4304735078 13921 Federal GW

¯
P

OU SG 13MU-14-8-22 IOU SG 13MU-14-8-22 SWSW 14 080S 220E 4304735079 13990 Federal GW P
OU SG 9MU-11-8-22 OU SG 9MU-11-8-22 NESE 11 080S 220E 4304735091 13967 Federal GW P
SG IlSG-23-8-22 SG 11SG-23-8-22 NESW 23 080S 220E 4304735099 13901 Federal GW S
OU SG 14W-11-8-22 OU SG 14W-1]-8-22 SESW 11 080S 220E 4304735114 14797 Federal GW DRL
SG 5MU-23-8-22 SG SMU-23-8-22 SWNW 23 080S 220E 4304735115 14368 Federal GW P
SG 6MU-23-8-22 ÃG 6MU-23 8-22 SENW 23 080S 220E 4304735116 14231 Federal GW P
SG 14MU-23-8-22 ISG 14MU-23-8-22 SESW 23 080S 220E 4304735117 14069 Federal GW P
SG 13MU-23-8-22 |SG 13MU-23-8-22 SWSW 23 080S 220E 4304735190 14103 Federal GW P
WH 7G-10-7-24 WH 7G-10-7-24 SWNE 10 070S 240E 4304735241 14002 Federal GW P
GB 4D-28-8-21 GB 4D-28-8-21 NWNW 28 080S 210E 4304735246 14645 Federal GW P
GB 7M-28-8-21 GB 7M-28-8-21 SWNE 28 | 080S ; 210E 430473524_7 | 14432 Federal GW _P
GB 14M-28-8-21 GB 14M-28-8-21 SESW 28 | 080S 210E 4304735248 13992 Federal GW P
SG 11MU-23-8-22 SG 11MU-23-8-22 NESW 23 080S 220E 4304735257 13973 Federal GW P
SG 15MU-14-8-22 SG 15MU-14-8-22 SWSE 14 | 080S 220E 4304735328 14338 Federal GW P
EIHX 14MU-25-8-22 EIHX 14MU-25-8-22 SESW 25 i 080S 220E 4304735330 14501 Federal GW P
EIHX llMU-25-8-22 EIHX llMU-25-8-22 NESW 25 I 080S 220E 4304735331 14470 Federal GW P
NBE 12ML-10-9-23 NBE 12ML-10-9-23 NWSW 10 | 090S 230E 4304735333 14260 Federal GW P
NBE 13ML-17-9-23 NBE 13ML-17-9-23 SWSW 17 i 090S 230E 4304735334 14000 Federal GW P
NBE 4ML-26-9-23 NBE 4ML-26-9-23 NWNW 26 | 090S 230E 4304735335 14215 Federal GW P
SG 7MU-11-8-22 SG 7MU-11-8-22 SWNE 11 080S i 220E 4304735374 14635 Federal GW P
SG 1MU-11-8-22 SG 1MU-11-8-22 NENE 11 080S 220E 4304735375 14279 Federal GW P
OU SG 13W-11-8-22 OU SG 13W-11-8-22 SWSW 11 080S 220E 4304735377 14796 Federal GW DRL
SG 3MU-11-8-22 SG 3MU-11-8-22 NENW 11 080S 220E 4304735379 14978 Federal GW P
SG 8MU-11-8-22 SG 8MU-11-8-22 SENE 11

,
080S 220E 4304735380 14616 Federal GW P

SG 2MU-11-8-22 SG 2MU-11-8-22 NWNE 11 080S 220E 4304735381 14636 Federal GW P
SG 10MU-11-8-22 SG 10MU-ll-8-22 NWSE 11 080S 220E 4304735382 14979 Federal GW P
OU GB 8MU-10-8-22 OU GB 8MU-10-8-22 SENE 10 080S 220E 430473_5422 15321 Federal GW DRL
EIHX 2MU-25-8-22 EIHX 2MU-25-8-22 NWNE 25 080S i 220E 4304735427 14666 Federal GW P
EIHX 1MU-25-8-22 EIHX 1MU-25-8--22 NENE 25 080S i 220E 4304735428 14705 IFederal GW P
EIHX 7MU-25-8-22 EIHX 7MU-25-8-22 SWNE 25 080S 220E 4304735429 14682 Federal GW P
EIHX 8MU-25-8-22 EIHX 8MU-25-8-22 SENE 25 080S 220E 4304735430 14706 Federal GW IP
EIHX 9MU-25-8-22 E1HX9MU-25-8-22 NESE 25 080S 220E 4304735433 14558 Federal GW P
EIHX 16MU-25-8-22 EIHX 16MU-25-8-22 SESE 25 080S 220E 4304735434 14502 Federal GW P
EIHX 15MU-25-8-22 EIHX 15MU-25-8-22 SWSE 25 080S 220E 4304735435 14571 Federal GW P
EIHX 10MU-25-8-22 EIHX 10MU-25-8-22 NWSE 25 080S 220E 4304735436 14537 Federal GW P
GB 3MU-3-8-22 1GB 3MU-3-8-22 NENW 03 0808 220E 4304735457 14575 Federal GW



6 of 8 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

OriginalWelIName QiQ SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease WellType IStatus

NBE 15M-17-9-23 NBE 15M-17-9-23 SWSE 17 090S 230E 4304735463 14423 Federal GW P
NBE 7ML-17-9-23 'NBE 7ML-17-9-23 SWNE 17 090S 230E 4304735464 14232 :Federal GW P
NBE 3ML-17-9-23 ,NBE 3ML-17Ã23 NENW 17 090S 230E 4304735465 14276 ÍFederal GW P
NBE 11M-17-9-23 NBE 11M-17-9-23 NESW 17 090S 230E 4304735466 14431 Federal GW P
NBE 10ML-10-9-23 NBE 10ML-10-9-23 NWSE 10 090S 230E

¯Õ04735650
14377 Federal GW P

NBE 6ML-10-9-23 NBE 6ML-10-9-23 SENW 10 090S 230E 4304735651 14422 Federal GW P
NBE 12ML-17-9-23 NBE 12ML-17-9-23 NWSW 17 090S 230E 4304735652 14278 FederaÏ GW _ P
NBE 6ML-26-9-23 NBE 6ML-26-9-23 SENW ' 26 | 090S 230E 4304735664 14378 Federal GW P
NBE 11ML-26-9-23 NBE 11ML-26-9-23 NESW 26

'
090S 230E 4304735665 14340 Federal GW P

NBE 15ML-26-9-23 NBE 15ML-26-9-23 SWSE 26 . 090S 230E 4304735666 14326 Federal GW P
SG 4MU-23-8-22 SG 4MU-23-8-22 NWNW I 23 080S 220E 4304735758 14380 Federal CW P
RWS 8ML-14-9-24 RWS 8ML-14-9-24 SENE 14 090S 240E 4304735803 14539 Federal GW S
SG IIMU-14-8-22 SG llMU-14-8-22 NESW 14 , 080S 220E 4304735829 14486 Federal GW P
RB DS FED 1G-7-10-18 RB DS FED 1G-7-10-18 NENE 07 100S 180E : 4304735932 14457 Federal OW S
RB DS FED 14G-8-10-18 RB DS FED 14G-8-10-18 SESW 08 100S 180E 4304735933 14433 Federal OW P
OU SG 14MU-1_4-8-22 OU SG 14MU-14-8-22 SESW 14 080S 220E . 4304735950 14479 Federal GW T
COY 10ML-14-8-24 COY 10ML-14-8-24 NWSE 14 0805 i 240E | 4304736038 Federal GW APD
COY 12ML-24-8-24 COY 12ML-24-8-24 NWSW 24 080S ' 240E 4304736039 14592 iFederal OW P
WIH lAMU-21-8-22 WIH lAMU-21-8-22 NENE 21 080S 220E 4304736060 14980 Federal GW P
NBE 4ML-10-9-23 NBE 4ML-10-9-23 NWNW 10 090S ' 230E 4304736098 15732 Federal GW P
NBE 8ML-10-9-23 NBE 8ML-10-9-23 SENE 10 I 090S 230E 4304736099 15733 Federal GW P
NBE 16ML-10-9-23 NBE 16ML-10-9-23 SESE 10 : 090S 230E 4304736100 14728 Federal GW P
NBE 8ML-12-9-23 NBE 8MÜl2-9-23 SENE 12 090S 230E 4304736Ï43| 15859 Federal IGW DRL
WH I2G-l l-7-24 WH 12G-11-7-2 NWSW 11 070S 240E 4304736195 Federal GW APD
HC 16M-6-7-22 _ HC 16M-6-7-22 SESE 06 070S 220E l 4304736197 Federal GW APD
HC 14M-6-7-22 HC 14M-6-7-22 ·SESW 06 070S 220E i 4304736198 ' Federal GW APD
WWT 8ML-25-8-24 iWWT 8ML-25-8-24 SENE 25 080S 240E 4304736199

¯
Federal GW APD

GB 16D-28-8-21 GB 16D-28-8-21 SESE 28 080S 210E 4304736260 14981 Federal GW P
WH 7G-3-7-24

¯
WH 7G-3-7-24 i SWNE 03 070S 240E 4304736347 Federal GW APD

NBE 5ML-10-9-23 NBE 5ML-10-9-23 SWNW 10 090S 230E 4304736353 15227 Federal GW P
NBE 7ML-10-9-23 NBE 7ML-10-9-23 SWNE 10 090S 230E 4304736355 15850 Federal GW DRL
NBE 3ML-10-9-23 NBE 3ML-10-9-23 NENW 10 090S 230E 4304736356 15393 Federal IGW P
WH 4G-10-7-24 WH 4G-10-7-24 NWNW 10 070S 240E 4304736359 Federal GW APD
EIHX 4MU-36-8-22 EIHX 4MU-36-8-22 NWNW 36 080S 220E 4304736444 I 14875 Federal GW P
EIHX 3MU-36-8-22 EIHX 3MU-36-8-22 NENW 36 . 0808 220E 4304736445 14860 iFederal GW P
EIHX 2MU-36-8-22 EIHX 2MU-36-8-22 NWNE 35 0805 220E 4304736446

¯]4840

Federal GW P
EIHX

1MU-36-8-22¯ ¯
EIHX 1MU-36-8-22 NENE 36 I 080S 220E 4304736447 14861 Federal GW P

WWT 2ML-24-8-24 WWT 2ML-24-8-24 NWNE 24 080S 240E 4304736515 Federal GW APD
RWS 1ML-1-9-24 RWS IML-1-9-24 NENE 01 090S 240E 4304736517 Federal GW APD
RWS 3ML-1-9-24 :RWS 3ML-1-9-24 ,NENW 01 090S 240E 4304736518 _ Federal |GW APD
RWS 9ML-1-9-24 |RWS 9ML-1-9-24 'NESE 01 090S 240E 4304736519 Federal GW APD
RWS 15ML-1-9-24 RWS 15ML-1-9-24 SWSE 01 090S 240E 4304736521

FederaÏ¯
[GW



7 of 8 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

BSW 1ML-12-9-24 BSW l_ML-12-9-24 NENE 12 090S 240E 4304736522 Federal GW APD
BSW 11ML-13-9-24 BSW 11ML-13-9-24 NESW 13 090S 240E 4304736523 Federal GW APD
NBE 7ML-26-9-23 NBE 7ML-26-9-23 ISWNE 26 090S 230E 4304736587 i 16008 Federal GW DRL
NBE 8ML-26-9-23 NBE 8ML-26-9-23 ISENE 26 090S 230E 4304736588 i 15689 IFederal GW P
NBE IML-26-9-23 NBE 1ML-26-9-23_ _ NENE 26 090S 230E 4304736589 | 15880 IFederal GW DRL
NBE 2ML-26-9-23 NBE 2ML-26-9-23 NWNE 26 090S 230E 4304736590 | 15898 Federal GW DRL
NBE 3ML-26-9-23 NBE 3ML-26-9-23 NENW 26 090S 230E 4304736591 i 15906 Federal |GW DRL
NBE 5ML-26-9-23 NBE 5ML-26-9-23 SWNW 26 090S 230E . 4304736592 i 15839 Federal GW DRL
NBE 9ML-10-9-23 NBE 9ML-10-9-23 NESE 10 090S 230E 4304736593 15438 Federal GW P
NBE 11ML-10-9-23 INBE 11ML-10-9-23 NESW 10 090S 230E 4304736594 15228 Federal IGW P
NBE 15ML-10-9-23 NBE 15ML-10-9-23 SWSE 10 090S 230E 4304736595 15439 Federal GW P
ÑIÈlML-12-9-23 NBE IML-12-9-23 NENE 12 i 090S 230E 43047366L3 i .Federal GW APD
NBE 2ML-17-9-23 NBE 2ML-17-9-23 NWNE 17 i 090S 230E 4304736614 15126 'Federal GW P
NBE4ML-17-9-23 NBE4ML-17-9-23 NWNW 17 090S 230E 4304736615 15177 Federal GW P
NBE 6ML-17-9-23 NBE 6ML-17-9-23 SENW 17 , 090S 230E 4304736616 15127 Federal GW |P
NBE 10ML-l7-9-23 NBE 10ML-17-9-23 NWSE 17 i 090S i 230E 4304736617 15128 Federal GW P
NBE 14ML-17-9-23 NBE 14ML-17-9-23 SESW 17 | 090S ; 230E 4304736618 15088 Federal GW P
NBE 9ML-26-9-23 NBE 9ML-26-9-23 NESE 26 090S 230E

43047366Ï9¯
15322 Federal GW P

NBE 10D-26-9-23 NBE 10D-26-9-23 NWSE 26 090S 230E 4304736620
1597¯¯Federal

GW DRL
NBE 12ML-26-9-23 NBE 12ML-26-9-23 NWSW 26 090S 230E 4304736621 15840 Federal GW DRL
NBE 13ML-26-9-23 NBE 13ML-26-9-23 SWSW 26 0908 230E 4304736622 15690 Federal GW P
NBE 14ML-26-9-23 NBE 14ML-26-9-23 SESW 26 0905 230E 4304736623 15262 Federal GW P
NBE 16ML-26-9-23 NBE 16ML-26-9-23 SESE 26 090Š 230E 4304736624 15735 Federal GW P
RWS 13ML-14-9-24 RWS 13ML-14-9-24 SWSW 14 090S 240E 4304736737 _ _ Federal GW APD
RWS 12ML-14-9-24 RWS 12ML-14-9-24 NWSW 14 090S 240E 4304736738 Federal GW APD
SG 3MU-23-8-22 SG 3MU-23-8-22 SESW 14 0808 220E 4304736940 15100 IFederal IGW P
NBE 5ML-17-9-23 NBE SML-17-9-23 SWNW 17 090S 230E 4304736941 15101 'Federal GW P
WWT 2ML-25-8-24 WWT 2ML-25-8-24 NWNE 25 080S 240E 4304737301 Federal GW APD
WWT IML-25-8-24 WWT IML-25-8-24 NENE 25 080S 240E 4304737302 Federal GW APD
HK 15ML-19-8-25 HK 15ML-19-8-25 SWSE 19 080S 250E 4304737303 Federal GW =APD
WT 13ML-19-8-25 WT 13ML-19-8-25 SWSW 19 080S 250E 4304737304 Federal GW APD
HK 3ML-29-8-25 HK 3ML-29-8-25 NENW 29 080S 250E i 4304737305 Federal GW APD
HK SML-29-8-25 HK 5ML-29-8-25 SWNW 2Õ 080S 250E 4304737330 Federal GW APD
HK 2ML-30-8-25 HK 2ML-30-8-25 NWNE 30 080S 250E 4304737331 Federal GW APD
HK SML-30-8-25 HK 5ML-30-8-25 SWNW 30 080S i 250E 4304737332 Federal GW APD
HK 10ML-30-8-25 HK 10ML-30-8-25 NWSE 30 080S 250E 4304737333 Federal GW APD
HK 14ML-30-8-25 HK 14ML-30-8-25 SESW 30 080S 250E 4304737334 Federal GW APD
HK 6ML-30-8-25 HK 6ML-30-8-25 SENW 30 080S 250E 430Ä737348 Federal GW APD
HK 8ML-30-8-25 HK 8ML-30-8-25 SENE 30 080S 250E 4304737349 Federal GW APD
WWT 7ML-25-8-24 WWT 7ML-25-8-24 SWNE 25 080S 240E 4304737407 Federal GW APD
WWT 9ML-25-8-24 WWT 9ML-25-8-24 NESE 25 i 080S 240E 4304737408 Federal GW APD
WWT 10ML-25-8-24 WWT 10ML-25-8-24 NWSE 25 | OSOS 240E 4304737409 Federal GW



8 of 8 QEP UintaBasin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WWT 15ML-25-8-24 WWT 15ML-25-8-24 SWSE 25 ' 080S 240E 4304737410 Federal GW APD
BBS 15G-22-7-21 BBS 15G-22-7-21 SWSE 22 070S i 210E 4304737443 15688 Federal |OW P
WWT 15ML-13-8-24 WWT 15ML-13-8-24 SWSE 13 080S 240E I 4304737524 Federal GW APD
WWT 16ML-13-8-24 WWT 16ML-13-8-24 SESE 13 080S 240E 4304737525 Federal GW APD
COY 6ML-23-8-24 COY 6ML-23-8-24 SENW 23 080S 240E 4304737526 Federal GW APD
NBZ8ML-23-8-24 NBZ8ML-23-8-24 SENE 23 080S 240E 4304737527 Federal GW APD
COY 9ML-23-S-24 COY 9ML-23-8-24 NESE 23 080S 240E 4304737528 Federal GW APD
NBZ 15ML-23-8-24 NBZ 15ML-23-8-24 SWSE 23 080S 240E 4304737529 Federal GW APD
COY 16ML-23-8-24 COY 16ML-23-8-24 iSESE 23 0808 240E 4304737530 Federal GW APD
COY 5ML-24-8-24 COY SML-24-8-24 SWl(W 24 0808 240E 4304737531 _ Federal GW APD
COY 6ML-24-8-24 COY 6ML-24-8-24 SENW 24 080S 240E 4304737532 Federal GW APD
COY 6ML-21-8-24 |COY 6ML-21-8-24 SENW 21 080S 240E 4304737584 Federal GW APD
COY 4ML-21-8-24 |COY 4ML-21-8-24 NWNW 21 080S 240E 4304737585 I Federal GW APD
COY 14ML-21-8-24 |COY 14ML-21-8-24 SESW 21 | 080S 240E

430473758T¯
Federal GW APD

2Ã COY 15ML-21-8-24 SWSE 21 080S 240E 4304737587 Federal GW NEW
WWT IML-24-8-24 WWT IML-24-8-24 NENE 24 - 080S 240E 4304737590 Federal GW APD
RWS 13ML-23-9-24 RWS 13ML-23-9-24

¯
SWSW 23 090S 240E 4304737591 Federal GW APD

WWT 8ML-24-8-24 WWT 8ML-24-8-24 SENE 24 080S 240E 4304737640 Federal GW APD
GB 16ML-20-8-22 GB 16ML-20-8-22 SESE 20 080S 220E 4304737664 15948 Federal

¯
GW DRL

NBZ IML-29-8-24 NBZ IML-29-8-24 NENE 29 080S 240E 4304737666 Federal GW APD
WWT 16ML-24-8-24 WWT 16ML-24-8-24 SESE 24 080S 240E 4304737930 Federal GW APD
WWT 15ML-24-8-24 WWT 15ML-24-8-24 SWSE I 24 0808 240E 4304737931 Federal GW APD
COY 14ML-24-8-24 COY 14ML-24-8-24

¯
SESW 24 0808 240E 4304737932 Federal lGW APD

COY 13ML-24-8-24 COY 13ML-24-8-24 SWSW 24 080S 240E 4304737933 Federal GW APD
COY l lML-24-8-24 COY 11ML-24-8-24 NESW 24 080S 240E 4304737934 I Federal i GW APD
COY 15ML-14-8-24 COY 15ML-14-8-24 SWSE 14 0803 240E 4304737935 i 'Federal 'GW APD
COY 14ML-14-8-24 COY 14ML-l4-8-24 SESW 14 080S 240E 4304737936_ iFederal |GW APD
COY 12ML-14-8-24 COY 12ML-14-8-24 NWSW 14 080S 240E 4304737937 Federal GW APD
COY l lML-14-8-24 COY 11ML-14-8-24 NESW 14 080S 240E i 4304737938 Federal GW APD
WVX 8ML-5-8-22 ,WVX 8ML-5-8-22 SENE 05 , 080S 220E 4304738140 Federal GW APD
WVX 6ML-S-8-22 |WVX 6ML-5-8-22 SENW 05 ' 080S I 220E 4304738141 Federal GW APD
BBS 5G-23-7-21 iBBS 5G-23-7-21 SWNW 23 070S 210E | 4304738471 Federal OW APD
GB 12SG-29-8-22 GB 12SG-29-8-22 NWSW 29 080S 220E 4304738766 Federal GW APD
GB 10SG-30-8-22 GB 10SG-30-8-22

¯
NWSE 30 080S 220E 4304738767 Federal GW APD

NBE 12SWD-10-9-23 NBE 12SWD-10-9-23 NWSW 10 090S 230E 4304738875 Federal |WD APD
OP 16MU-3-7-20 OP 16MU-3-7-20 SESE 03 0708 200E 4304738944 Federal OW lAPD

I
WF 1P-1-15-19 WF 1P-1-15-19 NWNW i 06 150S | 200E 4304736781 14862 |Indian |GW



STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

see attached
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwellsbelow current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or o See attacheddrillhorizontallaterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER;OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER.
QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, ORWILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 civ, Denver , CO ,,,80265 (303) 308-3068

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

9t CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^ci Ize O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart; CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTORFLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS REGLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: ÛpOf3ÍOr Name
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED ORCOMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., willhereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. This name change Involves only an Internal corporate name change and no thirdparty
change ofoperator is involved. The same employees willcontinueto be responsible for operationsofthe propertles described
on theattached list. AIIoperationswillcontinueto be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965003033
Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operator of record, QEP UINTABASIN, IN , hereby r signs as operatorof the properties as described on the
attached list.

Ja es , Executive Vice President, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIO ND PO UCTIONCOMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligationsas operatorof the properties as desc ed on the ttachedlist

Jayf. Neese, Exec tiveVice President
Questar Exploration and Production Company

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) D r3 K. ,Stanberry
TITLE Supervisor,Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE DATE 3/16/2007

(TMs space for Stato use only)

RECE'VED

APR1 8 2007
(fil2000) (See Instructions on ReverseSide)

Olv.0FOLys &



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSEAIALNUMBER.

see attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS IFINDIAN ALhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells,or to
See attacheddrlli horizontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR. 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver CO , 80265 (303) 308-3068

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFAce attached COUNTY. Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP,RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXESTO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^CIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Subrmt Original Form Only)
O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Well Name Changes
CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow allpertinentdetails Including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PER THE ATTACHED LIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTSTHATTHE
INDIVIDUALWELL NAMES BE UPDATED INYOUR RECORDS,

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) /i , TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE ...... --- 4/17/2007

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
APR13 2007(See lostructions on Reverse Side)

DN.OFOlL,GAS&MNNG

(5/200



United States Department of the Interior

. BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PNIDE

Utah State Office ogM ER IC A
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.b1m.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

January 23, 2008

Memorandum

To: Vernal Field Office

From: Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Subject: Name Change Approval

Attached is a certified copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of
State and a decision letter recognizing the merger from the Eastern States state office. We have
updated our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. into QuestarExploration and Production Co.
is effective May 1, 2007, which is a correction to the effective dated stated in the decision letter.
For verification of effective date, please refer to the name change certificate from the State of
Texas.

/s/ Leslie Wilcken

Leslie Wilcken
Land Law Examiner
Branch of Fluid Minerals

cc: MMS
State of Utah, DOGM,

bcc: Dave Mascarenas
Susan Bauman
Connie



RECENED FORMAPPROVED

UNITED STATES AUbMD T TE, Expr s er a , 995

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-72634

BL / ‡JALUIAH6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR N/A

TYPE OF WORK
7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

DRILL O DEEPEN O NIA

TYPE OF WELL
8. FARM OR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.

O O O siNGLE MULTIPLE

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE NBE 7ML-26-9-23

2. NAMEOF OPE TUORNTA
BASIN, INC.

Contact: Jan Neljan
nelson@questar.com

9.A4N BE

3. ADDRESS Telphone number 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

11002 E. 17500 S. Vernal, Ut 84078 Phone 435-781-4331 Fax 435-781-4323 NATURAL BUTTES

4. LOCATIONOF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*) 11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEYOR AREA

At Surface 2180' FNL 2151' FEL, SWNE, SECTION 26, T9S, R23E

At proposed production zone SEC.26, T9S, R23E Mer SLB

14. DISTANCE IN MILES FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POSTOFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 13. STATE

25 + l - SOUTHEAST OF VERNAL, UTAH Uintah UT

15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION TO NEAREST 16.NO.0F ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(also to nearest drig,unit line if any) 1760.00 40

2151' + I -

18.DISTANCEFROMPROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BLMIB1A Bond No. on file

completed, applied for, on this lease, ft 8623'
ESBOOOO24

1375' +/-

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.) 22. DATEWORK WILL START 23. Estimated duration

5227.6' GR ASAP 10 days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an exisiting bond on file (see

2. A DrillingPlan Item 20 above).

3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is on National Forest System Lands' 5. Operator certification.

the SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office) 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized officer.

SIGNED me (printed/typed) Jan Nelson DATE 8-17-06

TITLE Regulatory Affairs x ,nd Minin0
(This space for Federal or State office use)

FORRECORDONLY
PERMIT NO. APPROVAL DATE

Application approval does not warrant or cerlifythe appilcant holds any legal or equitabte title to those rights In the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL, IF ANY: AssistantFieldManager
APPROVED BY TITLE DATE /-/g

.py y

See Instructions On Reverse Side RECE IVED
Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any mater within its jurisdiction JAN3 0 007

NOTICEOF APPROVAL F



UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

VERNAL FIELD OFFICE
• 170 South 500 East VERNAL, UT 84078 (435) 781-4400

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company: QEP Uintah Basin, Inc. Location: SWNE, Sec 26, T9S, R23E
Well No: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Lease No: UTU-72634
API No: 43-047-36587 Agreement: N/A

Petroleum Engineer: Matt Baker Office: 435-781-4490 Cell: 435-828-4470

Petroleum Engineer: Michael Lee Office: 435-781-4432 Cell: 435-828-7875

Petroleum Engineer: Jim Ashley Office: 435-781-4470 Cell: 435-828-7874

Supervisory Petroleum Technician: Jamie Sparger Office: 435-781-4502 Cell: 435-828-3913

Environmental Scientist: Paul Buhler Office: 435-781-4475 Cell: 435-828-4029

Environmental Scientist: Karl Wright Office: 435-781-4484

Natural Resource Specialist: Holly Villa Office: 435-781-4404

Natural Resource Specialist: Melissa Hawk Office: 435-781-4476

After Hours Contact Number: 435-781-4513 Fax: 435-781-4410

A COPY OF THESE CONDITIONS SHALL BE FURNISHED TO YOUR
FIELD REPRESENTATIVE TO INSURE COMPLIANCE

All lease and/or unit operations are to be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with
the applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR Part 3160), and this approved Application for Permit to Drill

including Surface and Downhole Conditions of Approval. The operator is considered fully responsible

for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD must be on location during
construction, drilling, and completion operations. This permit is approved for a one-year period. An

additional year extension may be applied for by sundry notice prior to expiration.

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - Forty-Eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and access roads.

(Notify Karl Wright)

Location Completion - Prior to moving on the drilling rig.
(Notify Karl Wright)

Spud Notice -
Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.

(Notify Petroleum Engineer)

Casing String & Cementing - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to running casing and cementing all casing

(Notify Jamie Sparger) strings.

BOP & Related Equipment Tests - Twenty-Four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.

(Notify Jamie Sparger)

First Production Notice - Within Five (5) business days after new well begins or production

(Notify Petroleum Engineer) resumes after well has been off production for more than ninety (90)
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SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

SITE SPECIFIC CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
1. The buried pipeline exception request has been received. It has been determined that the pipeline

route has bedrock exposed at the surface. The exception is granted for a surface pipeline.

GENERAL SURFACE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
1. Operator shall notify any active gilsonite mining operation within 2 miles of the location 48

hours prior to any blasting during construction for this
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DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

All provisions outlined in Onshore Oil & Gas Order #2 Drilling Operations shall be strictly

adhered to. The following items are emphasized:

SITE SPECIFIC DOWNHOLE CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
1. An approved Sundry Notice is required before adding any oil to the drilling mud.

2. A Cement Bond Log (CBL) shall be run in the production casing from the TD to the top of
cement. A field copy of the CBL shall be submitted to the BLM Vernal Field Office for review.

DRILLINGICOMPLETION/PRODUCING OPERATING STANDARDS
1. There shall be no deviation from the proposed drilling, completion, and/or workover program as

approved. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling,
producing, suspended, or abandoned, shall be identified in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6.
There shall be a sign or marker with the name of the operator, lease serial number, well number,

and surveyed description of the well. Any changes in operation must have prior approval from
the BLM, Vernal Field Office Petroleum Engineers.

2. The spud date and time shall be reported orally to Vernal Field Office within 24 hours of
spudding.

3. Notify Vernal Field Office Supervisory Petroleum Engineering Technician at least 24 hours

in advance of casing cementing operations and BOPE & casing pressure tests.

4. Blowout prevention equipment (BOPE) shall remain in use until the well is completed or
abandoned. Closing unit controls shall remain unobstructed and readily accessible at all times.
Choke manifolds shall be located outside of the rig substructure.

All BOPE components shall be inspected daily and those inspections shall be recorded in the
daily drilling report. Components shall be operated and tested as required by Onshore Oil & Gas

Order No. 2 to insure good mechanical working order. All BOPE pressure tests shall be
performed by a test pump with a chart recorder and NOT by the rig pumps. Test shall be
reported in the driller's log.

BOP drills shall be initially conducted by each drilling crew within 24 hours of drilling out from

under the surface casing and weekly thereafter as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2.

Casing pressure tests are required before drilling out from under all casing strings set and
cemented in place.

No aggressive/fresh hard-banded drill pipe shall be used within casing.

Cement baskets shall not be run on surface casing.

The lessee/operator must report all shows of water or water-bearing sands to the BLM. If

flowing water is encountered it must be sampled and analyzed (a copy of the analyses to be
submitted to the BLM Field Office in Vernal,
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All oil and gas shows shall be adequately tested for commercial possibilities, reported, and
protected.

The lessee/operator must report encounters of all non oil & gas mineral resources (such as
Gilsonite, tar sands, oil shale, etc.) to Peter Sokolosky or another geologist of the Vernal Field

Office, in writing, within 5 working days of each encounter. Each report shall include the well

name/number, well location, date and depth (from KB or GL) of encounter, vertical footage of

the encounter and, the name of the person making the report (along with a telephone number)
should the BLM need to obtain additional information.

5. All shows of fresh water and minerals shall be reported and protected. A sample shall be taken

of any water flows and a water analysis furnished the BLM, Vernal Field Office. All oil and gas

shows shall be adequately tested for commercial possibilities, reported, and protected.

6. No location shall be constructed or moved, no well shall be plugged, and no drilling or workover

equipment shall be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the BLM, Vernal Field Office. If operations are to be suspended for more than 30

days, prior approval of the BLM, Vernal Field Office shall be obtained and notification given

before resumption of operations.

7. Chronologic drilling progress reports shall be filed directly with the BLM, Vernal Field Office

on a weekly basis in sundry, letter format or e-mail to the Petroleum Engineers until the well is
completed.

8. Any change in the program shall be approved by the BLM, Vernal Field Office. "Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells" (Form BLM 3160-5) shall be filed for all changes of plans and

other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Emergency approval may be obtained orally, but such approval does not waive the written report

requirement. Any additional construction, reconstruction, or alterations of facilities, including

roads, gathering lines, batteries, etc., which will result in the disturbance of new ground, shall

require the filing of a suitable plan pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 1 of 43 CFR

3164.1 and prior approval by the BLM, Vernal Field Office.

In accordance with 43 CFR 3162.4-3, this well shall be reported on the "Monthly Report of

Operations" (Oil and Gas Operations Report ((OGOR)) starting with the month in which
operations commence and continue each month until the well is physically plugged and
abandoned. This report shall be filed in duplicate, directly with the Minerals Management
Service, P.O. Box 17110, Denver, Colorado 80217-0110, or call 1-800-525-7922 (303) 231-

3650 for reporting information.

9. Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and

Recompletion Report and Log" (BLM Form 3160-4) shall be submitted not later than 30 days
after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance

with 43 CFR 3162.4-1. Two copies of all logs run, core descriptions, and all other surveys or

data obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, shall be
filed on BLM Form 3160-4. Submit with the well completion report a geologic report
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at a minimum, formation tops, and a summary and conclusions. Also include deviation surveys,
sample descriptions, strip logs, core data, drill stem test data, and results of production tests if
performed. Samples (cuttings, fluid, and/or gas) shall be submitted only when requested by the
BLM, Vernal Field Office.

10. A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the top of the cement

and shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy
of the CBL to this office.

11. Please submit an electronic copy of all other logs run on this well in LAS format to
UT_VN_Welllogs@BLM.gov. This submission will supersede the requirement for
submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

12. All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease shall have
prior written approval from the BLM, Vernal Field Office.

13. All measurement points shall be identified as point of sales or allocation for royalty
determination prior to the installation of facilities.

14. Oil and gas meters shall be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. The Field Office
Petroleum Engineers will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration and all
future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports shall be submitted to the
BLM, Vernal Field Office. All measurement facilities will conform to the API standards for
liquid hydrocarbons and the AGA standards for natural gas measurement.

15. A schematic facilities diagram as required by Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be submitted
to the BLM, Vernal Field Office within 30 days of installation or first production, whichever

occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be
adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively

sealed in accordance with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3.

16. This APD is approved subject to the requirement that, should the well be successfully completed
for production, the BLM, Vernal Field office must be notified when it is placed in a producing
status. Such notification will be by written communication and must be received in this office by
not later than the fifth business day following the date on which the well is placed on production.
The notification shall provide, as a minimum, the following informational items:

a. Operator name, address, and telephone number.

b. Well name and number.

c. Well location (¼¼,Sec., Twn, Rng, and P.M.).

d. Date well was placed in a producing status (date of first production for
which royalty will be paid).

e. The nature of the well's production, (i.e., crude oil, or crude oil and casing
head gas, or natural gas and entrained liquid
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f. The Federal or Indian lease prefix and number on which the well is
located; otherwise the non-Federal or non-Indian land category, i.e., State
or private.

g. Unit agreement and / or participating area name and number, if applicable.

h. Communitization agreement number, if applicable.

17. Any venting or flaring of gas shall be done in accordance with Notice to Lessees (NTL) 4A and
needs prior approval from Field Office Petroleum Engineers.

18. All undesirable events (fires, accidents, blowouts, spills, discharges) as specified in NTL 3A will
be reported to the BLM, Vernal Field Office. Major events as defined in NTL3A, shall be
reported verbally within 24 hours, followed by a written report within 15 days. "Other than
Major Events" will be reported in writing within 15 days. "Minor Events" will be reported on
the Monthly Report of Operations and Production

19. Pursuant to Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 7, this is authorization for pit disposal of water
produced from this well for a period of 90 days from the date of initial production. A permanent
disposal method must be approved by this office and in operation prior to the end of this 90-day
period. In order to meet this deadline, an application for the proposed permanent disposal
method shall be submitted along with any necessary water analyses, as soon as possible, but no
later than 45 days after the date of first production. Any method of disposal which has not been
approved prior to the end of the authorized 90-day period will be considered as an Incident of
Noncompliance and will be grounds for issuing a shut-in order until an acceptable manner for
disposing of said water is provided and approved by this office.

20. Unless the plugging is to take place immediately upon receipt of oral approval, the Field Office
Petroleum Engineers must be notified at least 24 hours in advance of the plugging of the well, in
order that a representative may witness plugging operations. If a well is suspended or
abandoned, all pits must be fenced immediately until they are backfilled. The "Subsequent
Report of Abandonment" (Form BLM 3160-5) must be submitted within 30 days after the actual
plugging of the well bore, showing location of plugs, amount of cement in each, and amount of
casing left in hole, and the current status of the surface



State of Utah OPERATOR ACCT. No. N-2460
Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.

ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South
ENTlTY ACTION FORM - FORM 6 Vernal, Utah 84078-8526 (435)781-4300

Action Current New Entity API Number Well Name QQ SC TP RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No.

99N9
9 43-047-36587 NBE 7ML 26 9 23 SWNE 26 9S 23E Uintah 2/27/07

WELL 1 COMMENTS:

WELL 2 COMMENTS:

WELL 3 COMMENTS:

WELL 4 COMMENTS:

WELL 5 COMMENTS:

ACTION CODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only)
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) (? y , JC - Re-assign well from one existingentity to another existing entity Signature
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section) OfficeAdministrator II 3/15/07

Title Date
NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected

Phone No. (435)781-4342
(3/89)



'°"3' UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
"''" DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR BudgetBureauNo.loD4-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March31, 1W3

5 Itase Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-72634
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals 5 Iffndian, AUotteeorTribeName

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE 7 ir unitor cA. Agreement oesignation
1 TypeofWell N/A

O U O - CONFIDENTIAL8 WellNameandNo.

NBE 7ML 26 9 23
2 NameofOperator

QEP, UINTA BASIN, INC. 9 API WeHNo.

1 AddmssandTelephoneNo COntact: Dahn.Caldwell@questar.com 43-047-36587
1571 East 1700 South - Vernal, UT 84078-8526 435-781-4342 Fax 435-781-4357 10. Field and Pool, or Explomtory Area

4 Location of Well(Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Swvey Description) NATURAL BUTTES
2180' FNL, 2151' FEL, SWNE, SEC 26-T9S-R23E 11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH , UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE B3X(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, 3R OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NoticeofIntent Abandonment C oŒW

O Recompletion M Cmwon

Subsequent Report PluggingBack Non-Routine Fracturing

O Final Abandonment Notice MC C m to

Other SPUD me**

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recom letion Report and Log form.)

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent delails, and give pettinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for allmarkers and zones pettinent to this work)

On 2/27/07 - Drilled 40' of 20" conductor hole. Set 40' of 14" conductor pipe. Cement w/ Ready Mix.

On 2/28/07, Drilled 12-1/4" hole to 2022'KB. Ran 45 jts of 9-5/8", J-55, 36# esg. Land shoe @1989'KB. Cmt surface w/400
sxs, pump 125 sxs down backside, no returns. Pump 125 sxs down backside. Pump 75 sxs down backside, cmt to surface.

RECEIVED
MMi 9 2007

3-BLM,2-UtabOG& ,1-benver,1-file Wor le-server DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING
I

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is se and .
Dahn F. Caldwe ffice Administrator II "" 3/15/07

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval,if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section1001, makes it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to maketo any departmentor agency ofthe UnitedStates any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements orrepresentations as to any matter withinits
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Spud Date: 2/27/2007
Location: 26- 9-S 23-E 26 - p gý- J gg Ÿ Rig Release: 3/18/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 26

Date From - To Hours Code S
e Description ofOperations

3/3/2007 - DRL 1 PETE MARTIN SPUD AT 0900 HRS., 2/27/2007. DRILLED 40'GL OF 20"
CONDUCTOR HOLE.SET 40' OF 14" CONDUCTOR PIPE. DRILLED MOUSE
AND RATHOLES.COMPLETEOPERATIONSAT1600 HRS.

DRL 1 BILL MARTIN JR RIG3 MOVEDIN AND SPUDDED AT 1300 HRS., 2/28/2007.
ORILLED 2022' KB OF 12 1/4" HOLE. RAN 45 JOINTS9 5/8 CASING, LAND
SHOE AT 1989 KB, FLOAT AT1946 KB. COMPLETE OPERATIONS AT 1600
HRS., 3/2/2007

CMT 2 BIG4 CEMENT SURFACE WITH 400 SACKS PREMIUM CEMENT. LAND PLUG
AT 1948 HRS., FLOAT HELD, NO RETURNS. PUMP 125 SACKSDOWN
BACKSIDE, NO RETURNS.WAIT 2 HRS. PUMP 125 SACKS DOWN BACKSIDE,
NO RETURNS, TOP OF CEMENT DOWN 200-250'. WAIT3 HRS ON CEMENT
ANDMORE WATER.PUMP 75 SACKS DOWN BACKSIDE, CEMENT TO
SURFACE.JOS COMPLETE AT 0200 HRS., 3/3/2007

3/9/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 LOC 3 MOVE RIG.& RIG UP. 90% RIG UP
18:00 - 06:00 12.00 OTH WAtT ON DAYLITE

3/10/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 LOC 4 FINISH R/U
09:00 - 15:30 6.50 BOP 2 TEST BOP. PIPE. BLIND.CHOKE KILLLINE. UPPER KELLY VALVE. CHOKE

MANIFOLD. 3000# ANNULAR & CSG 1500 #
15:30 - 18:30 3.00 TRP 1 P/U BHA. TAG CMT @1894'
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 DRL 4 DRILL CMT. FLT &SHOE.
19:30 - 20:30 1.00 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 1990' TI 2084' (SPUD @ 19:30 3/9/2007)
20:30 - 21:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @2000' i 1/4 DEG.
21:00 - 00:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 2084' TI 2592'
00:00 - 00:30 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY@2517' i 3/4 DEG.
00:30 - 04:30 4.00 DRL 1 DRfLL F/ 2592' T/ 3130'
04:30 - 05:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @3065' 2 1/2 DEG.
05:00 - 06:00 1,00 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 3160' T/ 3280'

3/11/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50 DRL 1 DRILL F/3280' T/ 3638'
08:30 - 09:00 0.50 RIG i RIGSERVICE.
09:00 - 09:30 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @3563' 2 DEG
09:30 - 11:30 2.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 3638' T/4051'
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @3976' 2 1/4 DEG.
12:00 - 16:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRILLFl 4051' TI 4589'
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @4510' 2 1/2 DEG
16:30 - 20:30 4.00 DRL 1 DRILLFI 4589'TI 5096'
20:30 - 21:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5020'
21:00 - 02:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 5096' Tl 5569'
03:00 - 06:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 5569' Tl 5780'

3/12/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 5780' T/
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE.
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY@6023' 2 DEG.
11:00 - 06:00 19.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 6103 TI 7385' (START MUD UP @6800' )

3/13/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/7385-7495
09:00 - 09:30

,
0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE

09:30 - 13:30 4.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/7495-7598
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 CIRC 1 MIXAND PUMP DRY JOS

DROP SURVEY AT 7525 2 DEGREES
14:00 - 19:00 5.00 TRP 10 TRIP FOR BIT DUETO PENETRATION RATE.

L/D 1BS'CHANGE OUT BITS
BIT NO. 2 HCSO4ZX
.22 MUD MOTOR60 HOURS.
TRIP IN HOLE TO 7538

19:00 - 19:30 0.50 REAM 1 REAM F/7538-7598

Pdnted: 4/5/2007 8:47:12 AM

RECElVED
APRO52007

DIV.0FO)L,GAS&
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Spud Date: 2/27/2007
Location: 26- 9-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 3/18/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 26

Date From - To Hours Code S
e Description of Operations

3/13/2007 19:00 - 19:30 0.50 REAM 1 5' FILL
19:30 - 22:00 2.50 DRL 1 DRILL Fl7598-7768
22:00 -04:00 6.00 CIRC i PICK UP AND CIRCULATE DO TO LARGE INFLUX IN GAS.

GO THROUGH GAS BUSTER AND INCREASE MUD WEIGHT FROM 10.0 TO
10.8

04:00 -05:30 1.50 CIRC 2 STARTED LOSING CIRCULATION. BRING UP LCM 5%
LOST 150 BBLS IN 2 HOURS.

05:30 - 06:00 0.50 DRL 1 DRILL F/7768-7790

TOTAL MUD LOSS 150 BBLS
3/14/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/7790-7958

13:00 - 13:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:30 - 20:30 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/7958-8054
20:30 - 21:00 0.50 CIRC 1 MIXAND PUMP DRY JOB
21:00 - 02:00 5.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT FOR BIT.

L/D MOTOR AND BIT.
P/U HUNTING .16 MOTOR AND SMITH 7.875 M1616 PDC
CHANGE BIT AND MOTOR AND TRIP IN BHA AND 15 STANDS.

02:00 - 03:00 1.00 RIG 6 CUT DRILL LINE
03:00 - 05:00 2.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN TO 7000'
05:00-05:30 0.50 CIRC 1 BEGINCIRCULATION.

PUMP DIED
05:30 - 06:00 i 0.50 WCL 1 WELL BEGAN BLOWING OUT.

SHUT IN WELL AND START KILLING PROCEDURE.
3/15/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00 WCL 1 CIRULATE THROUGH CHOKE. KILLWELL WITH 11.6+ MUD WEIGHT.

LOST 100 BBLS MUD DURING KILLPROCESS.
14:00 - 17:00 3.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION. BUILD VOLUME. LOSING 20 BBLS AN HOUR.

BRINGING MUD WEIGHT UP TO 11.8. INREASED LCM TO 15%. LOSSES
STOPPED.

17:00 - 17:30 0.50 TRP 10 TRIP IN TO 7990'
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH AND REAM 60' TO BOTTOM AT 8054'
18:00 -20:00 2.00 WCL 1 SHUT WELL IN AND CIRCULATE OUT BOTTOM GAS BUBBLE THROUGH

CHOKE.
20:00 - 04:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 8054-8425

(TD AT 8425)
BROUGHT WEIGHT UP TO 12. AND LCM TO 20%
NO LOSSESWHILE DRILLINGUNTILL 8300 HOLE DEPTH.
STARTED LOSING 20 BBLS AN HOUR.

04:30 - 06:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE FOR SHORT TRIP.
BRING LCM UP TO 22%. KEEP WT AT 12.0. LOSING 10 BBLS AN HOUR AT
0600. NOFLARE. 1500 UNITS OF GAS FROM GAS DETETION.

3/16/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 TRP 14 SHORT TRIP 5 STANDS
07:00 - 10:00 3.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND WAIT ON LOGGING TOOLS

(NO MUD LOSS)
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
10:30 - 22:00 11.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND WAIT ON LOGGING TOOLS
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 CIRC 1 MIX AND PUMP DRY JOB DROP SURVEY.
22:30 - 01:30 3.00 TRP 10 STRAP OUT TO PUT ON LOGGING TOOLS TO 3800'

SHLUMBERGER RELIZED SOME OF THE TOOLS NEEDED WERE NOT SENT
FROM CASPER. AND IT WOULD TAKE 7 HOURS FOR THEM TO ARRIVE.

01:30 -04:00 2.50 TRP 10 TRIP BACK IN THE HOLE.
04:00 - 04:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH TO BOTTOM F/8371-8425 NO FILL

Printed: 4/5/2007 8:47:12
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Spud Date: 2/27/2007
Location: 26- 9-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 3/18/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 26

Date From - To Hours Code CSude Description of Operations

3/16/2007 04:00 - 04:30 0.50 REAM 1 (LOST 50 BBLS FROM TRIP)
04:30 -06:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND WAIT ON LOGGING TOOLS

(30' FLARE FROM TRIP GAS)
3/17/2007 06:00 -09:00 3.00 CIRC 1 WAIT ON LOGGING TOOLS

09:00 - 09:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
09:30 - 11:00 1.50 CIRC 1 WAIT ON LOGGING TOOLS
11:00 - 11:30 0.50 CIRC 1 MIXAND PUMP DRY JOB.
11:30 - 12:30 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT TO 7500'
12:30 - 13:00 0.50 CIRC 1 MIXAND PUMP 15# DRY JOB.
13:00 - 17:30 4.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT. L/D MOTOR AND BIT.
17:30 - 18:30 1.00 TRP 1 PIK UP DRILL STRING LOGGINGTOOLS WITH SCHLUMBERGER.
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN BHA AND 16 STANDS OF DRILL PIPE.
19:30 -02:00 6.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN AND LOG TO 7782'

BROKE CIRCULATION EVERY 2000'
LOST CIRULATION AT 7782'

02:00 -03:00 1.00 CIRC 6 BUILD MUD VOLUME
03:00 - 04:00 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT 13 STANDS
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 CIRC 6 BUILD MUD VOLUME.

TOTAL LOSS FROM TRIP 140 BBLS.
3/18/2007 06:00 - 08:30 2.50 CIRC 1 BUILD VOLUME. REGAINED CIRCULATION AT 0630.

CIRCULATED AND BUILT VOLUME. LOST 30 BBLS.
TOTAL OF 180 BBLS FROM TRIP.

08:30 -09:30 1.00 TRP 2 STAGE IN 5 STANDS. CHECK CIRCULATION. TRIP IN 8 STANDS AND
CIRCULATE.

09:30 - 11:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND BUILD VOLUME.
LOST 10 BBLS.

11:00 - 11:30 0.50 TRP 10 TRIP IN LOGGING WITH SCHLUMBERGER 4 STANDS AND A SINGLE TO
BOTTOM-8425

11:30 - 12:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION
12:00 - 12:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:30 - 13:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE. RIG UP WEATHERFORD TRS L/D MACHINE
13:00 - 14:00 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT 10 STANDSAND LOG.
14:00 - 22:00 8.00 TRP 3 L/D DRILL PIPE AND LOG OUT WITH SCHLUMBERGER.
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN 10 STANDSAND BREAK KELLY.
22:30 - 02:00 3.50 TRP 1 UD DRILL PIPE, BHA AND LOGGINGTOOLS.
02:00 -03:00 1.00 CSG 1 RIG UP WEATHERFORD TRS CASIMG CREW.
03:00 -06:00 3.00 CSG 2 RUN CASING BREAK CIRCULATION AT 3500'

NO LOSS.

TOTAL LOSSES 40 BBLSOF MUD.
3/19/2007 06:00 -09:30 3.50 CSG 2 RUN 190 JOINTS OF 4.5" 11.6# P-110 CASING, AND 2 MARKER JOINTS.

1ST MARKER JOINT AT 4225'
2ND MARKER SET AT 6013'
SHOE TOP AT 8414.62
FLOAT AT 8368.76

09:30 - 11:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE OUT GAS. RIG DOWN WEATHERFORD TRS AND RELEASE.
11:00 - 11:30 0.50 CMT 1 RIG UP HALIBURTON CEMENTERS.

HOLD SAFETY MEETING
11:30 - 14:30 3.00 CMT 2 CEMENT PRODUCTION CASING WITH 400 SACKS HI-FILL LEAD AND 1110

SACKS 50/50 POZ TAIL. FLOAT HELD. 30 BBLS CEMENT TO PITS.
14:30 - 16:30 2.00 BOP 1 NIPPLE DOWN BOP.
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 CSG 7 SET SLIPSWITH CAMERON

Printed: 4/Sf2007 8:47:12



Questar E &P Page 4 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Spud Date: 2/27/2007

Location: 26- 9-S 23-E 26 Rig Release: 3/18/2007
Rig Name: TRUE Rig Number: 26

Date From - To Hours Code S
e Description of Operations

la,92,2oor17:00-21:00 4.00 LOC 7 ,CLEANPITS

21:00 - 06:00 9.00 LOC 4
G RELWENASWEDH2150HOA3/1DS007

Printed: 4/5/2007 8 47:12



,WNHOURR
Page 1 of 6Questar E & P

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Spud Date: 2/27/2007
Location: 26- 9-S 23-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: 3-0 f- S Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

4/5/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 LOC 4 On 4/4/07 - Initial Completion Report. MIRU Rocky MtnWell Service. ND frac
valve &NU 7-1/16" 5K BOP, PU, tally& rabbit in hole w/ 3-7/8" bit, 4-1/2" csg
scraper, 1 jt 2-3/8" J-55 tbg, 1.8?' F-Nipple & 256 jts new J-55 2-3/8" tbg to tag @
7343'. Circulate clean w/ 120 bbis 2% KCL water. LD 17 jts tbg to put EOT @
7790'. SWIFN.

24 Hr Forecast: Will POOH w/ bit.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 11.6# P-110
Csg Depth: 8415'

4/6/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 On 4-5-07 SITP =0#. SICP=0#.
Finish POOH w/ 3 7/8" bit, 4 1/2" csg scraper & 2 3/8" tbg. NOBOP & NU 4 1/16"
10K Frac Valve. Pressure test csg &frac valveto 5000#. OK. RUCutters WL &
perforate per CBL dated 3-29-07 intervals 80024)8'; 7960-064'; 7888-90'; 7878-82'.
RDMO Cutters WL. Breakdown perfs @2700#. Pump 5 bbis KCL wtr @ 1.5 bpm
& 2550# ISIP=2200#. SWIFWE.

24 hr forecast will be on standby Friday & frac on Monday.

Casing size: 4 1/2" 11.6# P-110
Casing depth: 8415

Perfs:
L.Mesaverde
8002 -08'

7960 -64'

7888 -90'

7878 -82'

4/10/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 On 4/9/07 SICP = 1500#. MIRU Halliburton Frac Crew& Cutters WL. Pre-iob
safety meeting.
Zone 1 - Lower Mesa Verde - 7878'- 8008'. Breakdown @3338#, Pump SS gal
scale inhibitor & 400 gals 28% HCL ahead of 237 bbl pad. Frac wÏ DeRa 200 fluid
system, Ramp 1-4 ppg 20/40 Ottawa Sand in 680 bbis fluid. Flushwl400 gais 28%
HCLin 122 bbis water. Total load = 983 bois. Total sand = 75,000#. Avg rate = 44
BPM, max rate = 60 BPM,Avg psi = 3998#, Max psi = 5886#. ISIP = 3388#. FG =

(.86).Cut sand early due to Mountain Mover problems. Pumped 75,000#of
100,000#design,
Zone 2 - Lower Mesa Verde - Lube in frac plug @7770'. Perf per CBL dated
3/29/07 intervals 7718'- 7724'; 7690'- 7694'; 7644'- 7646' & 7630'- 7634'. Frac w/
Delta 200 fluid system. Break @2637#. Pump 55 gal scale inhibitor ahead of 231
bblpad. Ramp 1-4 ppg 20/40 Ottawa Sand in 584 bbl fluid. FLush w/ 400 gal 28%
HCL in 120 bbl water. Total load = 869 bbis. Total sand = 65,700#. Avg rate = 45
BPM, max rate = 58 BPM, avg psi = 4542#, max psi = 8242#. ISIP = (.83).Cut
sand early due to net pressure increase. Pumped 65,700#of 100,000# design.
Zone 3 - Lower Mesa Verde - lube in frac plug @7500'. Perforate per CBL dated

Prlnted: 5/2/2007 9:53:43 AM

MAYO2 2007
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Questar E & P Page 2 of 6

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Spud Date: 2/27/2007
Location: 26- 9-S 23-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code CS
e Description of Operations

4/10/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 3/29/07 intervals 7458' - 7464', 7446' - 7450' & 7416' - 7422'. Frac w/ Delta 200
fluid system. Breakdown @3121#. Pumped 55 gal scale inhibitor ahead of 240 bbi
pad. Ramp 1-4 ppg 20/40 Ottawa Sand in 562 bbl fluid. Flush w/ 400 gal 28% HCL
in 38 bbl water. Total load = 782 bbis. Total sand = 62,900#. Avg rate = 42 BPM,
max rate = 49 BPM, avg psi = 3210#, max psi = 9870#. ISIP = 4397#. Screened
out on flush, leaving 110 sxs sand in wellbore. Flowed well back. Cut sand early
due to net pressure increase. Pumped 62,900#of 100,000# design.
Zone 4 - Lower Mesa Verde - Cancelled frac plug. Perforate per CBL dated 3/29/07
intervals 7246' - 7254', 7218' - 7222' & 7178' - 7182'. SDFN.

24 hr forecast: Will continuewith frac job.

Casing size: 4 1/2" 11.6# P-110
Casing depth: 8415

Perfs:
Lower Mesa Verde
8002' - 8008'
7960' - 7964'
7888' - 7890'
7878' - 7882'
7718' - 7724'
7690' - 7694'
7644' - 7646'
7630' - 7634'
7458' - 7464'
7446' - 7450'
7416' - 7422'
7246' - 7254'
7218' - 7222'
7178' - 7182'

4/11/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 On 4/10/07, SICP = 2000#. Pre-job safety meeting.
Zone 4 - Lower Mesa Verde 7178' - 7254'. Breakdown @2500#. Pump 55 gal
scale inhibitor & 400 gal 28% HCL ahead of 473 bbl pad. Frac wl Delta 200 fluid
system. Ramp .5- 4 ppg Ottawa Sand in 972 bbls fluid. Flush w/ 400 gal 28% HCL
in 116 bbl water. Total load = 1477 bbis. Total sand = 101,800#. Avg rate = 42
BPM, Max rate = 50 BPM, Avg psi = 2942#, Max psi = 4295#. ISIP = 1746#. FG =

.68.

Zone 5 - Mesa Verde/ Wasatc lube in frac plug @6210'. Perf per CBL dated
3/29/07 intervals 6144' - 6152'; 6038' - 6042' & 6016' - 6020'. Frac w/ Delta 200
fluid system. Breakdown @ 1851#. Pump 55 gal scale inhibitor ahead of 207 bbl
pad. Ramp 1-5 ppg 20/40 Ottawa Sand in 523 bbl fluid. Flush w/ 400 gals 28%
HCL in 97 bbis water. Total load = 770 bbis. Total sand = 61,000#. Avg rate = 39
BPM, max rate = 46 BPM, avg psi = 2575#, max psi = 3521#. ISIP = 1905#. FG =

(.75).Cut sand early due to net pressure increase. Pumped 61,000#of 100,000#

Printed: 5/2/2007 9:53:43
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Questar E & P Page 3 of 6

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Spud Date: 2/27/2007
Location: 26- 9-S 23-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

4/11/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 3 design.
Zone 6 - Wasatch - Lube in frac plug @5800'. Perforate per CBL dated 3/29/07
intervals 6746' - 5750' & 5630' - 5636'. Frac wl Delta 200 fluid system. Breakdown
@6621#. Pumped 55 gal scale inhibitor ahead of 281 bbis pad. Ramp 1-5 ppg
20/40 Ottawa Sand in 310 bbis fluid. Flush w/ 55 bbis water. Total load = 612 bbis.
Total sand = 34,400#. Avg rate = 33 BPH, max rate = 38 BPM, avg psi = 2938#,
max psi = 8807#. Screened out on flush, leaving 62 sxs sand in wellbore. Flowed
well back for 1/2 hours & shut in. Cut sand early due to net pressure increase.
Pumped 34,400#of 45,000# design. Shut well in for 2 hrs. Turn wellover to flow
watch @3:00 PM. Open well w/ 750#on csg on 10/64" choke. Flowed esg for 2
hours on 10/64" choke. Shut in due to a lot of sand comingback. Open again in 2
hours and flowed again for 2 hrs & a lot of sand comingback again. Shut in for 2
hours. Opened again and flowed til5:30 AM, little sand. Flowed on 10/64" choke &
750# csg pressure. Shut well in @5:30 AM for kill plug w/ 750# on csg.

24 hr forecast: Will lube in killplug.

Casing size: 4 1/2" 11.6# P-110
Casing depth: 8415

Perfs:
Lower Mesa Verde
8002' - 8008'
7960' - 7964'
7888' - 7890'
7878' - 7882'
7718' - 7724'
7690' - 7694'
7644' - 7646'
7630' - 7634'
7458' - 7464'
7446' - 7450'
7416' - 7422'
7246' - 7254'
7218' - 7222'
7178' - 7182'
Mesa Verde
6144' - 6152'

I
Wasatch
6038' - 6042'
6016' - 6020'
5746' - 5750'
5630' - 5636'

4/12/2007 \06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DRL 5 On 4/11/07, SICP = 1000#. Cutters WL still RU. Set 4-1/2" killplug @5150'. Bleed
well off & RDMO Cutters WL. ND frac valve & NU BOP. RlH wl 3-7/8" cone bit,

Printed: 5/2/2007 9:53:43



Questar E & P Page 4 of 6

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Spud Date: 2/27/2007
Location: 26- 9-S 23-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

4/12/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DRL 5 shear sub, 1 jt tbg, 1.81" F-Nipple & 2-3/8" J-55 tbg to killplug. RU drilling
equipment & drill up kill plug @5150'. Clean out sand from 5170'- 5235'. RIH &
drill frac plug @5800' & 6210'. Circulate clean w/ 120 bbis 2% KCL water & pull
above perfs. SWIFN & lock rams.

24 hr forecast: Will finish drilling up plugs & land tbg.

Casing size: 4 1/2" 11.6# P-110
Casing depth: 8415

Perfs:
Lower Mesa Verde
8002' - 8008'
7960' - 7964'
7888' - 7890'
7878' - 7882'
7718' - 7724'
7690' - 7694'
7644' - 7646'
7630' - 7634'
7458' - 7464'
7446' - 7450'
7416'-7422'
7246' - 7254'
7218' - 7222'
7178' - 7182'
Mesa Verde
6144' -6152'

Wasatch
6038' - 6042'
6016' - 6020'
5746' - 5750'
5630' - 5636'

4/13/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DRL 5 On 4/12/07 SICP = 2200#, SITP = 0#. Blow csg down to 900#. RIH fl 5500' w/
3-7/8" bit, shear sub & tbg. RU drilling equipment& drill up frac plug @7500'. RIH
& clean out sand from 7723' to 7770'. Drillup frac plug @7770'. RIH & clean out
sand from 8310' to 8343' (PBTD). Circulate well clean @8343' w/ 120 bbis 2% KCL

i water. LD 16 jts. Land tbg on hanger @7823.95' w/ F-Nipple @7790.58'. ND
BOP, drop ball & NUWH to flow manifold. Pump bit off@ 1800#. Flow tbg to pit.
Open on 28/64" choke wl 1450#on tbg, 1775#on csg @2:30 pm.
6:00 pm 1275#on tbg, 1825#on csg on 28/64" choke making 40 BPH.
9:00 pm has 1250#on tbg, 1900#on csg on 28/64" choke, making40 BPH.
12:00 am has 1250# on tbg, 1950# on csg on 28/64" choke, making30 BPH.
3:00 am has 1300#on tbg, 2050#on csg on 28/64" choke, making30 BPH.
6:00 am has 1250#on tbg, 2100#on csg on 28/64" choke, making20 BPH.

Printed: 5/2/2007 9:53:43
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Spud Date: 2/27/2007
Location: 26- 9-S 23-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code S
e Description of Operations

4/13/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 DRL 5 Recovered a total of 496 bbis.

LLTR: 4998 bbls

24 hr forecast: Will finish drilling up plugs & land tbg.

Casing size: 4 1/2" 11.6# P-110
Casing depth: 8415

Perfs:
Lower Mesa Verde
8002' - 8008'
7960' - 7964'
7888' - 7890'
7878' - 7882'
7718' - 7724'
7690' - 7694'
7644' - 7646'
7630' - 7634'
7458' - 7464'
7446' - 7450'
7416' - 7422'
7246' - 7254'
7218' - 7222'
7178' - 7182'
Mesa Verde
6144' - 6152'
Wasatch
6038' - 6042'
6016' - 6020'
5746' - 5750'
5630' - 5636'

4/16/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 LOC 4 On 4/13/07 RDMO Rocky Mtn Well Service. NU WH to sales line. Turn well over to
production. NU WH to sales lilne. Turn well over to production. FINAL
COMPLETION REPORT.

LLTR: 4998 bbis

Casing size: 4 1/2" 11.6# P-110
Casing depth: 8415

Perfs:
Lower Mesa Verde
8002' - 8008'
7960' - 7964'
7888' - 7890'

Printed: 5/2/2007
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 Spud Date: 2/27/2007
Location: 26- 9-S 23-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

4/16/2007 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 LOC 4 7878' - 7882'
7718' - 7724'
7690' - 7694'
7644' - 7646'
7630' - 7634'
7458' - 7464'
7446' - 7450'
7416' - 7422'
7246' - 7254'
7218' - 7222'
7178' - 7182'
Mesa Verde
6144' - 6152'
Wasatch
6038' - 6042'
6016' - 6020'
5746' - 5750'
5630' - 5636'

Tbg Detail
KB 12.00
Hanger 0.85
240 jts 2-3/8" J-55 7776.82
1.81" F-Nipple 0.91
1 jt 2-3/8" J-55 32.46
Bit Sub 0.91
Tbg Tail @ 7823.95
F-Nipple @ 7790.58

I
Printed 5/2/2007



Fonn 31¾
Forn approved.

(November 1983) UNITED STATES SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE Budget Bureau No. 1004-0137

(formerly 9-330) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR (See other in- Expires August 31, 1985

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT structionson

reverseside), 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

UTU -72634

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG * N/A

la. TYPE OF WELL OIL GAS 7. UNIT AGREEMENTNAME

WELL WELL DRY Other N/A

b TYPE OF COMPLETION

NEW WORK DEEP- PLUG DIFF. 8. FARMORLEASENAME

WELL OVER EN BACK RESVR Other N/A

2 NAME OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. NBE 7ML 26 9 23

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. Contact: Dahn Caldwell 435-781-4342 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1571 East 1700 South - Vernal, UT 84078 Fax # 435.781.4357
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance wit& any State reµironmis)* NATURAL BUTT ES

At surt.ce SWNE, SEC 26-T9S-R23E, 2180' FNL, 2151' FEL 11. SEC.,T.,R., M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY

OR AREA

At top rod. interval reponed below SWNE, SEC 26-T9S-R23E, 2180' FNL, 2151' FEL SEC26-19S-R23E

At total depth SWNE, SEC 26-T9S-R23E, 2180' FNL, 2151' FEL
14. PERMITNO. DATEISSUED 12 COUNTYOR 13. STATE

PARISH
43447-36587 UINTAH UT

15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (Readyto prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DI .RKB, RT, GR, ETC.)* 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

02/27/07 03/14/07 04/13/07 3
20. TOTAL DEP1H, MD & TVD 21. PLUG BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLECOMPL., 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANY* DRILLED BY

8,425' 8,343' --->

24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTIOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEYMADE

SEE ATTACHMENT PAGE 1 NO

26 TYPE ELECIRIC AND OTHER IßGS RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED

COMPENSATED NEUTRON/GR & CBL/VDL/GRICCL NO

28 CASINGRECORD(Reportafstrinessetinwell)

CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET(MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

9-5/8" 36# 1,989' 12-1/4" 725 SXS
4-1/2" 11.6# 8,415' 7-7/8" 1,510 SXS

29 LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD

SIZE TOP (MD) BOTIOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT' SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEFIH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2-3/8" 7,824'

31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interm( size and number) r- O '" 32. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

SEE ATTACHMENT PAGE 1 m a- DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

SEE ATTACHMENT PG 1 SEE ATTACHMENT PAGE 1

33.* PRODUCTION

DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (FTowinggas aft,pumping-size and type ofpump) WELL STATUS (Producingor
shut-in)

04/13/07 FLOWING PRODUCING
DATEOFTEST HOURSTESTED CHOKESIZE PROD'NFOR OIL-BBL. GAS--MCF. WATER-BBL GAS-OILRA110

TESTPERIOD

04/15/07 24 18/64" 106 1,466 389
FIDW.TUBINGPRESS. CASINGPRESSURE CAl£ULATED OIL-BBL GAS--MCF WATER-BBL OILGRAVITY-API(CORR)

24-HOUR RATE

1,532 2,189
34. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Soki, usedfor fuel,vented, etc.) TEST WITNESSED BY

SOLD
35. LISTOF ATTACHMENTS

WELLBORE SCHEMATIC & PERFORATION DETAIL ATTACHMRT PAGE 1

36. I hereby certifythat the foregoingand attached onaation is plete ami conect detenn vailable records

SIGNED JIM SIMONTON (A¾ w Å E COMPLETION SUPERVISOR DATE - 06/12/07

(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to artment or of the

United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any



37. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES: (Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof; cored intervals; and all

drill-stem tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures, and 38. GEOLOGIC MARKERS

recoveries):
NBE 7ML 26 9 23

FORMATION TOP BOTTOM DESCRIPTION,CONTENTS, ETC. TOP

UINTA SURFACE NAME MEAS. DEPTH TRUE

GREEN RIVER 1443'
VERT. DEPTH

WASATCH 4343' UINTA SURFACE

MESA VERDE 6173' GREEN RIVER 1443'

TD 8425' WASATCH 4343'
MESA VERDE 6173'
TD 8425'





UToe698P41
FIELD: Natural Buttes East GL: 5,233 ' KBE: 5,245 ' Spud Date 2-27-07 Date of last wo 4-13-07

Well: NBE 7ML-26-9-23 TD: 8,425 ' PsTD: 8,343 ' currentWellstatus:Producing
Location - surface: 2180' FNL,2151' FEL,SWINESec. 26, TSS, R23E Reason for Pull/Workove Initial Gas Completion

API#:43-047 36587 Uintah County, Utah Deviation:

Weilbore
Schematic Tubing Landing Detail:

Description Size Footage Depth
KB 12.00 12.00

Surface casing Hanger 0.85 12.85

Size: 9-5/8" 240 jts..1-55 2-3 8" 7,776.82 7,789.67

Weight: 36# F-nipple w/ 1.81" ID " 0.91 7,790.58

Grade: 3-55 1jt. jts..1-55 2-3 8" 32.46 7,823.04

Set @ 1989 Notch Collarshear sub " 0.91 7,823.95

Cmtd w/ 725 E0T 0 7,823.95

Holesize: 12-1/4"
Tubing Information:
Condition:
New: X Used: Rerun:

TOC@ 2730 ' Grade: 3-5
Weight(#/ft): 4.7#

EKCLUDEDPERFS OPENPERFS

Weilhead Deta Example: 7-1/16" 3000#

I
I 4 1/16" 10K

Other:
Hanger: Yes & No

SUMMARY
4-4-07

2cne 1Fracw/ 75,000#Ottawasand, L Mesaverde 7878'-8008'

2cne 2 Frac w/ 65,700f Ottawasand. L Mesaverde 763Œ- 7724'

Zone 3Fracwf62,900f Ottawasand. L Mesaverde 7416-7464'

2cne 4 Fracw/ 101,200#Ottawasand. L Mesaverde 7178'- 7294'

Zone! Fracw/ 61,000f Ottawasand. Mesa/Wasatch 6016'-6152'

Zone EFracw/ 34,400f Ottawa sand. Wasatch 563Œ-5757
4-13-07 Tumed welloverto poduction.

5630'-5636' w/3 jpf
5746'-5750' w/3 jpf

6016'-6020' w/3 jpf
6038'-6042'w/3 jpf
6144'-6152' w/3 jpf

7178'-7182' w/3 jpf
7218'-7222' w/3 jpf
7246'-7254' w/3jpf

7416'-7422' w/3 jpf
7446'-7450' w/3 jpf
7458'-7464' w/3 jpf

7630'-7634' w/3 jpf
7644'-7646' w/3 jpf
7690'-7694' w/3 jpf
7718'-7724' w/3 jpf

F Nipple@ 7791 '
EOT@ 7824 '

7878'-7882' w/3 jpf
7888'-7890' w/3 jpf

Production Casing 7960'-7964' w/3 jpf
Size: 4 1/2" j 8002'-8008' w/3 jpf
Weight: 11.6#
Grade: P-110

Prepared By:Todd Selffert Date:



Fon 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

U""*'99°) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993

5 Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-72634

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 5 If Indian, AllotteeorTribeName

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE """°r cA, Agreement Designation

I, Type of Well Natural Buttes East Unit
Oil Gas

Well Well Other 8 Well Name and No.

NBE 7ML 26 9 23
2 Name of Operator

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. API Wel1No.

1 Address and Telephone No. COntact: Debbie Stanberry 43-047-36587
1050 17TH Street, Suite 500 Denver CO 80265 Phone: (303) 308-3068 10, Field and Pool, or Exploratoly Area

4 Location of Well (Footage, Sec, T., R., M., or Survey Description) Natural Buttes East

2180'FNL, 2151'FEL; SWNE S26-T9S-R23E 11. CountyorParish,State

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, )R OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment C o la

O Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Mm Casing Cmiono *tion

Other Commingling Dispose water

(Note) Repon results of multiple completion on Well
Com letion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent letails, and give pertinent dates, includingestimated date of staning any proposed work. If well is directionallydrilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for affmarkers and zones pertinent to this work)

"In compliance with the stated objectives of the Federal Regulations for Onshore Oil & Gas Operations and the applicable Federal Unit Agreement, Questar
Exploration and Production Company hereby requests the commingling of production between intervals in the NBE 7ML 26 9 23. Questar considers this
commingling to be in the public interest in that it promotes maximum ultimate economic recovery, prevents waste, provides for orderly and efficient
production of oil and gas and presents no detrimental effects from commingling the two gas streams.

Questar requests approval for the commingling of production between the Mesa Verde and Wasatch intervals. The initial allocation is being estimated from
the net pay of the Mesa Verde and Wasatch formations. That allocation would be:

Wasatch Production: 16% - for 47' of net pay
Mesa Verde Production: 84% - for 250' of net pay

On an annual basis the gas will be sampled and a determination will be made of the BTU content and gas con ts. These annual samples can be used to
determine if the gas allocation is changing over time. If these sampiegpipgigiggpggggggustments in y they may be
discontinued after the fifth anniversary of the initial production.

Date: le40 $ SEP1't 2007
Initials: DNOFOIL,GAS&MIN a

14. ISigenreed
sor Re ul or Affa s Date 9/11/2007

(This space for Federal or State office use) Utah Divis
and B ActionisNecessary

Approved by: Title On,Gas oate
Conditions of approval, if any

T le 18 U Section 10m0al,makes i crim df réany personknowinglyand willfully to make to any departm or a e f it
, fict i or fraudulentstatementsor

*See instruction on Reverse



INTENTS TO COMMINGLE
MULTIPLE POOLS IN ONE WELLBORE

(R649-3-22)

1. An affidavit of notice and a plat were not submitted as required
by R649-3-22.

2. Future requests for commingling shall include all parts required
by R649-3-22 and shall be submitted together as one request,
not in separate



(11/14/2007) Dustin Doucet - RE: Commingyng Requests Page 1

From: "Debbie Stanberry" <Debbie.Stanberry@questar.com>
To: "Dustin Doucet" <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Date: 11/2/2007 11:40 AM
Subject: RE: ComminglingRequests

Just to let you know I have not forgotten this. Iwillfollow up with
our land department next week and hopefully willhave the additional
information to forward on to you. Thank you for your patience and have
a good weekend.

Debbie Stanberry
(303) 308-3068

-----Original Message-----
From: Dustin Doucet [mailto:dustindoucet@utah.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, October 24, 2007 11:47 AM
To: Debbie Stanberry
Subject: Commingling Requests

Debbie,

I received 4 requests back in September and was getting ready to approve
them,but did not have all the info required by our rule R649-3-22. A
plat of allwells overlaying the pool, contiguous leases etc. is needed
along with an affidavitthat the applicationfor comminglinghas been
sent to all owners. The wells in question are as follows:

GB 16ML 20-8-22 API 4304737664
NBE 7ML 26-9-23 API 43-047-36587
GH 15ML 18-8-21 API 43-047-35323
GB 8D-20-8-22 API 43-047-37665

Let me know if you have questions. Thanks.

Dustin

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Oil and Gas Program
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84116

Phone: (801) 538-5281
fax: (801) 359-3940
email:





AFFIDAVIT OF NOTICE

STATE OF COLORADO )
COUNTY OF DENVER ) ss:

Nathan C. Koeniger, being duly sworn, deposes and says:

1. That I am employed by QuestarExploration and Production Company in the
capacity as a Landman. My business address is:

Independence Plaza
1050 17thStreet, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265

2. In my capacity as a Landman, pursuant to the provisions of Utah
Administrative Rule 649-3-22, I have provided a copy of QuestarExploration
and Production Company's application for completion of the NBE 7ML-26-9-
23 well into two or more pools, in the form of Utah Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining's Form 9 Sundry Notice, to owners of all contiguous oil and gas leases
or drilling units overlying the pools which are the subject of that application.

3. In my capacity as a Landman, I am authorized to provide such notice of
QuestarExploration and Production Company's application to contiguous
owners and to make this affidavit on this 29'" day of August 2008.

Printed Name: Nathan C. Koeniger

The foregoing instrument was sworn to and subscribed before me this day of
p s 2008, by Nathan C. Koeniger.

THER.ESACHATMAN
-NOTARYPUBLIC-

STATEOF
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COMMINGLED PRODUCTION

Uinta Basin-Uintah County, Utah

Commingled well Well: NBE 7ML 26-9-23
Lease: UTU 72634

Geologist

Landman:NateKoenigerProduction
1050 17th St., # 500 Denver, CO 80265 Date:July1,



MAILING LIST
NBE 7ML-26-9-23

NOTICE OF COMMINGLING

Anadarko Petroleum Corporation
1999 Broadway - Suite 3600
Denver, CO 80202
Attn: W. Chris Latimer

EOG Resources, Inc.
600 17'" Street - Suite 1000N
Denver, CO 80202
Attn: Uinta Division Land Manager

III Exploration Company
555 South Cole Road
Boise, Idaho 83707
Attn: William Glynn/Ken Smith

Enduring Resources, LLC
475 17th Street
Suite 1500
Denver, CO 80202

Forest Oil Corporation
707 17thStreet #3600
Denver, CO 80202
Attn: Uinta Division Land



Questar Exploration and Production Company

1n0d5e0p1e7ndheSncreeet,a
uite 500

Denver, CO 80265

Tel 303 672 6900 • Fax 303 294 9632

Rocky Mountain Region

August 29, 2008

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

RE: Sundry Notice of Commingling

To Whom It May Concern:

Enclosed for approval, please find QuestarExploration and Production Company's
Sundry Notice of Commingling for the NBE 7ML-26-9-23 well located in T9S-R23E
Section 26: SWNE.

Should you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me at (303) 672-6906 or
by email at nate.koeniger@questar.com.

When available, it would be appreciated if an approved copy was sent to the undersigned
using the letterhead address above.

Very truly yours,

Nathan C. Koeniger
Landman

Enclosure

RECEIVED
SEP10 2008

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



Form 3160.5 UNITED STATES FORM^PPRovE
°'"" ' " DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ÜÌÊÔË

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease SerialNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-72634

Do not use thisform for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned weit Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

N/A

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Other Instructions on reverse side
7. ironstor cA/Agreement, Nameand/or No.

1. TypeofWell NATURALBUTTES EAST
Oil Well O Gas Well [

¯|

Other 8. WellName andNo.
2. Nameof Operator NBE 7ML-26-9-23
Questar Exploration & Production Co. Contact: Mike Stahl 9. API wellNo.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No, (include area code) 43-047-36587
11002 East 17500 South. Vernal, UT 84078 |303-308-3613 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of WelI (Footage, Sec., T , R., M., or Survey Description) NATURALBUTTESE AST
2180' FNL 2151' FEL, SWNE, SECTION 26, T9S, R23E I l. County or Parish,State

UINTAH
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES)TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
O Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon ComminglingO Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back WaterDisposal
13 Describe Proposed or Completed Opemliotts (cleady gale all pcrânent Jesails, including estimated starúng date of any proposed work aruf approximate duration th<r¢otif the proposal is to desposa diivetionally or recomplew hwixenmity, give subsprface focations and uncumred and true verti¢al depths of all pertinent .m.arkets and amesAttach the Bond under which the work will be perf.rmed a provide dae Bond No. on liÏe whh BLM/01A, Required subscqu<nt reports shatt be filed within 30 daysFollowing completion of the involved opermions if the opermion teschs in a multipic cómpktion of recompletion in a new int<rval, a F¢wm 1140-4 shall be fikki enteTend.ng has been completed, 14xtal Abandonment Notices chan be (4cd only after di requirements, including recinstation, have been compicte.L and the opcrator harderrrnised that the sacìs ready for final inspectiond

In Compliance with the Administrative Utah code for drillling and operating practice R649-3-22, completion into two or more
pools. Questar Exploration & Production Company hereby requests the comminglingof productionbetween intervals in the
NBE 7ML-26-9-23. Questar considers this commingling to be in the public interest in that it promotes maximumultimate
economic recevery, prevents waste, provides for orderly and efficient productionof oil and gas and presents no detrimental
effects from commingling the gas streams.
Questar requests approval for the commingling of production of the Wasatch and Mesa Verde intervals. Based upon offset
production logs, the proposed initial allocation is as follows:

Wasatch Production: 16% - for 4T of net pay. Mesa Verde Production: - 84% for 250' of net pay,

On an annual basis the gas willbe sampled and a determination willbe madeof the BTUcontent and gas constituents. These
annual samples can be used to determine if the gas allocationis changing over time.If these samples do not indicate that any
adjustments in allocation are necessary they may be discontinues after the fifth anniversary of the initial production.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Conditions of approval, if any,are attached, Approvalofthis noti t ÍÍ O
IpSpNecessa

that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the sub ec whic
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person kno gly and willfully eut or agency ofth United States any false, fictitious or

fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within jminction RFCFIVED
(histtwiions on roerse)

SEP70 2008 Q
DIV.0FOlL,GAS&



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUSSEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/20104a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Enerav FORMA.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

See attached
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See attached
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° See attacheddrillhorizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL
8. WELLNAMEand NUMBEIROIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER
See attached

2 NAMEOF o XR Of

tiOn and Production Company $$ $ Att che
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver

, CO z, 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See attached couuTY: Attached
QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE
SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This namechange involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The sameemployees willcontinue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. AIIoperations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965868683
Fee Land Bond Number:
BIA Bond Number: 799446- 9/p O/O(o JS
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As ofJune 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described onthe list

d n Regulato0ryAffairs Analyst

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED APPROVED /g
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side) . .

DIV,OFOIL,GAS&MINING Dmslon of011,GasandMinin
EarleneRussell.Ennineerina



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

WEST RIVER BEND 3-12-10-15 12 100S 150E 4301331888 14542 Federal OW P CWEST RIVER BEND 16-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332057 14543 FederaÍOW PWEST DESERT SPRING l l-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301332088 14545 Federal OW SGD 8G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333821 Federal OW APD CGD 9G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333822 Federal OW APD CGD 10G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333823 Federal OW APD CGD llG-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333824 Federal OW APD CGD 12G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333825 Federal OW APD CGD 13G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333826 Federal OW APD CGD lG-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333827 16920 Federal OW PGD 2G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333828 Federal OW APD CGD 7G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333829 Federal OW APD CGD 7G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333830 Federal OW APD CGD 14G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333831 Federal OW APD CGD 15G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333832 Federal OW APD CGD 16G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333833 16921 Federal OW PGD 1G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333834 Federal OW APD CGD 2G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333835 Federal OW APD CGD 3G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333836 Federal OW APD CGD 4G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333837 Federal OW APD CGD 5G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333838 Federal OW APD CGD 6G-35-9-15 35 090S 150E 4301333839 Federal OW APD CGD 8G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333840 Federal OW APD CGD 9G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333841 Federal OW APD CGD 10G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333842 Federal OW APD CGD 15G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333843 Federal OW APD CGD 16G-34-9-15 34 090S 150E 4301333844 Federal OW APD CGOVT 18-2 18 230S 170E 4301930679 2575 ed ÖÑFEDERAL 2-29-7-22 29 070S 220E 4304715423 5266 Federal GW TAUTAH FED D-1 14 070S 240E 4304715936 10699 Federal GW SUTAH FED D-2 25 070S 240E 4304715937 9295 Federal GW SPRINCE 1 10 070S 240E 4304716199 7035 Federal GW PUTAH FED D-4 14 070S 240E 4304731215 9297 Federal GW SISLAND UNIT 16 11 100S 180E 4304731505 1061 Federal OW SEAST COYOTE FED 14-4-8-25 04 080S 250E 4304732493 11630 Federal OW PPRINCE 4 03 070S 240E 4304732677 7035 Federal OW PGH 21 WG 21 080S 210E 4304732692 11819 Federal GW POU SG 6-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304732746 11944 Federal GW SFLU KNOLLS FED 23-3 03 100S 180E 4304732754 12003 Federal OW PGH 22 WG 22 080S 210E 4304732818 12336 Federal GÑOU GB 12W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304733249 13488 Federal GW POU GB 15-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733364 12690 Federal GW POU GB 3W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304733513 12950 Federal GW PÖÜÜB 7 i-D ÒÌ)iii0E 4304733514 12873 Federal GW PWV 9W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733515 13395 Federal GW POU GB 9W-18-8-22 18 Ã80f220E Ì304733 liššŸ Vedil äW3OU GB 3W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304733526 13514 Federal GW POU GB 12W-30-8-22 3i 080S 220E 4304733670 13380_ Federal GW PWV 10W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733814 13450 Federal GW PGH 7W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733845 13050 Federal GW PGH 9W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733846 13074 Federal GW P

Bonds: BLM = ESBOOOO24
BIA = 956010693

State = 965010695 1 of



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well_name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

GH 11W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733847 13049 Federal GW P
GH 15W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304733848 13051 Federal GW P
WV 2W-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733905 13676 Federal GW P
WV 7W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733907 13230 Federal GW P
WV 9W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733909 13160 Federal GW P
GH 14W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304733915 13073 Federal GW P
OU GB 4W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733945 13372 Federal GW POÚÐ 9W-19-8-22 19 [080S 3i0È Ã30Ì71Ì94Ì 5593 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304733947 13389 Federal GW P
OU GB 12W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304733948 13388 Federal GW P
GB 9W-25-8-21 25 080S 210E 4304733960 13390 Federal GW P
SU lW-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733985 15569 Federal IGW P
SU 3W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733987 13321 Federal OW S
SU 7W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733988 13235 Federal GW P
SU 9W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733990 13238 Federal GW P
SU 13W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 14304733994 13236 Federal GW TA
SU 15W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304733996 13240 Federal GW P
WV 8W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734005 13320 Federal GW P
WV 14W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734007 13322 Federal GW S
OU GB 6W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734018 13518 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734025 13502 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734039 13413 Federal GW P
OU GB 4W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734043 13520 Federal GW P
GH 5W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734147 13387 Federal GW P
GH 6W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734148 13371 Federal GW P
GH 8W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734149 13293 Federal GW P
GH 10W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734151 13328 Federal GW P
GH 10W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734152 Ï3378 Federal GW P
GH 12W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734153 13294 Federal GW P
GH 14W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734154 13292 Federal GW P
GHiÃW-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734157 13329 Federal GW P
WV 2W-3-8-21 03 080S 210E 4304734207 13677 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734209 13414 Federal GW P
WV 6W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734272 13379 Federal GW P
GH 1W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734327 13451 Federal GW P
GH 2W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734328 13527 Federal GW P
GH 3W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734329 13728 Federal GW P
GH 7W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734332 13537 Federal GW P
GH 9W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734333 13411 Federal GW P
GH 11W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734334 13410 Federal GW P
GH 15W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734335 13407 Federal GW P
GH 16W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734336 13501 Federal GW P
WV 12W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734343 13430 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734348 13495 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734349 13507 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734350 13526 Federal GW P
SU PURDY 14M-30-7-22 30 070S 220E 4304734384 13750 Federal GW S
WVX 11G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734388 13422 Federal OW P
WVX 13G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734389 13738 Federal OW P
WVX 15G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734390 13459 Federal OW P
SU BRENNAN W 15W-18-7-22 18 070S 220E 4304734403 13442 Federal GW TA

Bonds: BLM= ESBOOOO24
BIA = 956010693

State = 965010695 2 of



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

SU 16W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734446 13654 Federal GW P
SU 2W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734455 13700 Federal GW P
SU 10W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734456 13540 Federal GW P
WV 16W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734470 13508 Federal GW P
OU GB 16WX-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734506 13431 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734512 13469 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734513 B461

Federal¯ÙW
P

OU GB SW-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734514 13460 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734515 13462 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734516 13489 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734517 13467 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734522 13476 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734528 13487 Federal GW S
OU GB 3W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734529 13493 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734530 13519 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734531 13494 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734532 13483 Federal GW P
OU GB 9W-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734533 13500 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734534 13475 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734535 13479 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734536 13478 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734537 13484 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734538 13482 Federal GW P
OU GB 12W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734542 13543 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734543 13536 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734544 13547 Federal GW P
OU GB 6W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734545 13535 Federal GW P
OU GB 3W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734546 13509 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734547 13506 Federal GW P
OU GB 4W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734548 13534 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734549 13505 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734550 13550 Federal GW _P
OU GB 11W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734553 13671 Federal GW P
OU GB 14W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734554 13528 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734559 13539 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734560 13599 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734563 13559 Federal GW P
OU GB 1W-29-8-22 29 080SE220E 4304734573 13562 Federal GW P
OU GB 7W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734574 13564 Federal GW P
OU GB 8W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734575 13609 Federal GW S
OU GB 9W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734576 13551 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734577 13594 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734578 13569 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734599 13664 Federal GW P
OU GB 2W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734600 13691 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734601 13632 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734602 13639 Federal GW P
OU GB 16W-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734603 13610 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734604 13612 Federal GW P
OU GB lW-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734623 13701 Federal GW P
OU GB 9W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734624 13663 Federal GW P
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
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OU GB 10W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734625 13684 Federal GW P
OU GB 9W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734630 13637 Federal GW P
OU GB 10W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734631 13682 Federal GW P
OU GB 15W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734632 13613 Federal GW P
OU WIH 15MU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734634 13991 Federal GW P
OU WIH 13W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734646 13745 Federal GW P
OU GB 11W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734648 13822 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-9-8-22 09 080S 220E 430473468 13706 Federal GW P
OU WIH 14W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734664 13720 Federal GW P
OU GB 12WX-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734668 13555 Federal GW P
OU WIH 10W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734681 13662 Federal GW P
OU GB 4G-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734685 13772 Federal OW P
OU GB 3W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734686 13746 Federal GW P
OU GB 16SG-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304734688 13593 Federal GW P
OU WIH 7W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734689 13716 Federal GW P
OU GB 5W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734690 13770 Federal GW P
WIH 1MU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734693 14001 Federal GW P
OU GB 5G-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734695 13786 Federal OW P
OU GB 7W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734705 13710 Federal GW P
OU SG 14W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734710 13821 Federal GW P
OU SG 15W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734711 13790 Federal GW P
OU SG 16W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734712 13820 Federal GW P
OU SG 4W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734713 13775 Federal GW P
OU SG 12W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734714 13838 Federal GW P
OU GB 5MU-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734715 13900 Federal GW P
OU SG 8W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734717 13819 Federal GW P
OU SG 9W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734718 13773 Federal GW P
OU SG 10W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734719 13722 Federal GW P
OU SG 2MU-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734721 13887 Federal GW P
OU SG 7W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734722 13920 Federal GW P
OU GB 14SG-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734743 14034 Federal GW P
OU GB 16SG-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734744 13771 Federal GW P
OU GB 13W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734754 13774 Federal GW P
OU GB 6MU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734755 14012 Federal GW P
OU SG 10W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734764 13751 Federal GW P
OU GB 14M-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734768 13849 Federal GW P
OU SG 9W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734783 13725 Federal GW P
OU SG 16W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734784 13781 Federal GW P
SU BW 6M-7-7-22 07 070S 220E 4304734837 13966 Federal GW P
GB 3M-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734900 14614 Federal GW P
WVX 11D-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734902 14632 Federal GW P
GB 11M-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734952 13809 Federal GW P
GB 9D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734956 14633 Federal GW P
GB 1D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734957 14634 Federal GW P
WRU EIH 2M-35-8-22 35 080S 220E 4304735052 13931 Federal GW P
GH 12MU-20-8-21

_

20 080S 210E 4304735069
_

14129 Federal GW fOU SG 4W-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735071 14814 Federal GW OPS C
OU SG 5W-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735072 14815 Federal GW OPS C
SG 6ML-11-8-22 11 080BOE 4304735073 14825 Federal GW P
OU SG 5MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735076 13989 Federal GW P
OU SG 6MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735077 14128 Federal GW P
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
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SG 12MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735078 13921 Federal GW P
OU SG 13MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735079 13990 Federal GW P
OU SG 9MU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735091 13967 Federal GW P
SG 11SG-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735099 13901 Federal GW TA
OU SG 14W-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735114 14797 Federal GW OPS C
SG 5MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735115 14368 Federal GW P
SG 6MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735116 14231 Federal GW P
SG 14MU-23-8-22 23 |080S 220E 4304735117 14069 Federal GW P
SG 12MU-23-8-22 . 23 080S 220E 4304735188 14412 Federal GW P
SG 13MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735190 14103 Federal GW P
WH 7G-10-7-24 10 070S 240E 4304735241 14002 Federal GW S
GB 4D-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304735246 14645 Federal GW P
GB 7M-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304735247 14432 Federal GW P
GB 14M-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304735248 13992 Federal GW P
SG llMU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735257 13973 Federal GW P
SG 15MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735328 14338 Federal GW P
EIHX 14MU-25-8-22 _ 25 080S 220E 4304735330 14501 Federal GW P
EIHX 11MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735331 14470 Federal GW P
NBE 12ML-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304735333 14260 Federal GW P
NBE 13ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735334 14000 Federal GW P
NBE 4ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735335 14215 Federal GW P
SG 7MU-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735374 14635 Federal GW S
SG lMU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735375 14279 Federal GW P
OU SG 13W-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735377 14796 Federal GW OPS C
SG 3MU-ll-8-22 11 080S 220E 94304735379 14978 Federal GW P
SG 8MU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735380 14616 Federal GW P
SG 2MU-11-8-22 11 080S 220E 4304735381 14636 Federal GW P
SG 10MU-1µ8-22

_ _ 11 080S 220EL4304735382 _ 14979 Federal GW P
SU 11MU-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304735412 14143 Federal GW P
OU GB 8MU-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304735422 15321 Federal GW OPS C
EIHX 2MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735427 14666 Federal GW P
EIHX 1MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735428 14705 Federal GW P
EIHX 7MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735429 14682 Federal GW P
EIHX 8MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735430 14706 Federal GW P
EIHX 9MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735433 14558 Federal GW P
EIHX 16MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735434 14502 Federal GW P
EIHX 15MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735435 14571 Federal GW P
EIHX 10MU-25-8-22 25 080S 220E 4304735436 14537 Federal GW P
GB 3MU-3-8-22 03 080S 220E 4304735457 14575 Federal GW P
NBE 15M-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735463 14423 Federal GW P
NBE 7ML-17-9-23 _ 17 090S 230E 4304735464 14232 Federal GW P
NBE 3ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735465 14276 Federal GW P
NBE 11M-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735466 14431 Federal GW P
NBE 10ML-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304735650 14377 Federal GW P
NBE 6ML-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304735651 14422 Federal GW P
NBE 12ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304735652 14278 Federal GW P
ÑBE 6ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735664 14378 Federal GW P
NBE 11ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735665 14340 Federal GW P
NBE 15ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304735666 14326 Federal GW P
SG 4MU-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304735758 14380 Federal GW P
SG 11MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735829 14486 Federal GW P
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efectiveJune 14,2010
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PJ3 I)S FEE) 03-7-10-18 07 100S 180E 4304735932 14457 Federal (39V S
RB DS FED 14G-8-10-18 08 100S 180E 4304735933 14433 Federal OW P
OU SG 14MU-14-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304735950 14479 Federal GW PÈÒŸ2MEÑ-8-i4 2 050S34NÈ̂Ï0iŠ605 74¾ Fediai OW P
WIH lAMU-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304736060 14980 Federal GW P
SU 8M-12-7-21 12 070S 210E 4304736096 16610 Federal GW OPS CFIBE4hdL-10 9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736098 15732 Federal 939V P
14EGE8AILe10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736099 15733 Federal (39V P
14EMB16A4L-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736100 14728 Federal (ITV S
SUBW 14M-7-7-22 07 070S 220E 4304736136 15734 Federal GW P
14BE8AILel2-9-23 12 090S 230E 4304736143 15859 Federal GNV S5516D-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304736260 14981 Federal GMÏP14BE5AIL-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736353 15227 Feder<d (IMT P
14EGE7hfL,10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736355 15850 Federal (IVV P
14EME3A4L-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736356 15393 Federal (39V P
EIHX 4MU-36-8-22 36 080S 220Ë4304736444 14875 Federal GW P
EI_HX3MU-36-8-22 36 080S BE 4304736445 14860 Federal GW P
EIHX 2MU-36-8-22 36 080S 220E 4304736446 14840 Federal GW S
EIFTKINfD-36-8-22 36 080S 220E 4304736447 14861 Federal 39V P
14BJE7hfL-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736587 16008 Federal (19V P
14BE 8hfL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736588 15689 Federal (39V P
FIBE lhdL-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736589 15880 Federal (FYV P14BE2AIL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736590 15898 Federal (39V S
NBE 3ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736591 15906 Federal GW P
14EGE5hdL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736592 15839 Federal (39V P
14E0E9hdi,10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736593 15438 Federal (19V P
14EMSllAILe10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736594 15228 Federal (39V P
IREGE15AdL,10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304736595 15439 Federal (ITV P
FIBE2AIL,17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736614 15126 Federal (39V P14BGE4NIL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736615 15177 Federal (JyV P
14BGE6NIL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736616 15127 Federal (39V S
14EGE10AIL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736617 15128 Federal (19V P
14BE 14AdL-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736618 15088 Federal (39V P
14E0E9AIL,26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736619 15322 Federal (19V P
NBE 10D-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736620 15975 Federal GW S
NBE 12ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736621 4T Federal GW P
NBE 13ML-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736622 15690 Federal GW P
FIBE 14NIL-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304736623 15262 Federal (39V P
NBE 16ML-26-9-2 26 090S 230E 4304736624 15735 Federal_ GW P
WF lP-1-15-19 06 150S 200E 4304736781 14862 Indian GW P
SG 3NTU-23-8-22 14 080S 220E 4304736940 15100 Federal GNV P
NBE 5ML-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304736941 15101 Federal GW P
TU 14-9-7-22 070S RE 4304737345 16811 Federal GW OPS C14C-29-15-19 29 150S 190E 4304737541 15178 Indian GW PFIBE2AIL-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304737619 15860 Federal GNV P
GB 16AIL-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304737664 15948 Federal GVV P

ML-5-8-22_ 05 080S 220E_/304738140 Federal GW APD C
WVX 6ML-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304738141 Federal GW ,APD CWVX 1MU-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304738156 Federal GW APD C
GH 8-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304738157 Federal GW APD CWVX 4MU-17À-21 17 080S 210E 4304738190 Federal GW APD C
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
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WVX 16MU-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738191 Federal GW APD C
GH 7D-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304738267 16922 Federal GW P
WF 8C-15-15-19 15 150S 190E 4304738405 17142 Indian GW OPS C
WVX 1MU-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738659 Federal GW APD C
WVX 9MU-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738660 Federal GW APD C
GB 12SG-29-8-22 | 29 080S 220E 4304738766 16096 Federal GW S
GB 10SG-30-8-22 30 080S 220E 4304738767 16143 Federal GW S
FR 14P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739168 16179 Federal GW P
SU 11M-8-7-22 08 070S 220E 4304739175 Federal GW APD C
HB 2M-9-7-22 09 070S 220E 4304739176 Federal GW APD C
SUMA 4M-20-7-22 20 070S 220E 4304739177 Federal GW APD C
SU 16M-31-7-22 31 070S 220E 4304739178 Federal GW APD C
FR 13P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739226 16719 Federal GW P
SG 11BML-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304739230 ederal GW APD
SG 12DML-23-8-22 23 080S 220E 4304739231 Federal GW APD C
GB ICML-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304739232 Federal GW APD C
NBE 8CD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739341 16513 Federal GW P
NBE 15AD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739342 Federal GW APD C
NBE 6DD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739343 Federal GW APD C
NBE 6AD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739344 Federal GW APD C
NBE 6BD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739345 Federal GW APD C
NBE 5DD-10-9-23 10 090S 230E 4304739346 16574 Federal GW
NBE 7BD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739347 Federal GW APD C
NBE 4DD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739348 16743 Federal GW P
NBE 10CD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739349 16616 Federal GW P
NBE llCD-17-9-23 17 090S 230E 4304739350 Federal GW APD C
NBE 8BD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739351 16617 Federal GW P
NBE 3DD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739352 Federal GW APD C
NBE 3CD-26-9-23 26 090S 230Ï4304739353 Federal GW APD C
NBE 7DD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739354 Federal GW APD C
NBE 12AD-26-9-23 _ 26 090S 230E 4304739355 Federal GW APD C
NBE 5DD-26-9-23 _ 26 090S 230E 4304739356 Federal GW APD C
NBE 13AD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739357 Federal GW APD C
NBE 14AD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739358 Federal GW APD C
NBE 9CD-26-9-23 26 090S 230E 4304739359 Federal GW APD C
FR 9P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739461 17025 Federal GW S
FR 13P-11-14-20 17 140S 200E)4304739462 Federal GW APD C
FR 9P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739463 16829 Federal GW P
FR 10P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739465 Federal GW APD C
FR 5P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739509 Federal GW APD C
FR 15P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739510 Federal GW APD C
FR llP-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739587 Federal GW APD
FR 5P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739588 Federal GW [APD C
FR 9P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739589 Federal GW APD CFR 13P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739590 Federal GW APD C
GB 7D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304739661 Federal GW APD C
GB 15D-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304739662 16830 Federal GW P
WV 13D-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304739663 16813 Federal GW P
WV 15D-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304739664 16924 Federal GW P
FR 14P-17-14-20 17 140S 200E 4304739807 Federal GW APD C
FR 12P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739808 Federal GW APD C
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Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
effective June 14, 2010
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FR 6P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304739809 16925 Federal GW P
FR 3P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739810 Federal GW APD C
FR 4P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739811 16771 Federal GW P
FR 8P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304739812 Federal GW APD C
FR 15P-21-14-20 21 | 140S 200E 4304739815 Federal GW APD C
FR 2P-20-14-20 20 140S 200E 4304740053 Federal GW APD
FR 2P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304740200 Federal GW APD C
WV 11-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304740303 Federal GW APD C
GB 12-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304740304 Federal GW APD C
GH 11C-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304740352 Federal GW APD C
GH 15A-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304740353 Federal GW APD C
GH 10BD-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304740354 Federal GW APD C
FR 11P-21-14-20 21 140S 200E 4304740366 Federal GW APD C
MELANGE Ul 09 140S 200E 4304740399 Federal GW APD C
OP 16G-12-7-20 12 070S 200E 4304740481 17527 Federal OW DRL C
OP 4G-12-7-20 12 070S 200E 4304740482 Federal OW APD C
WF 8D-21-15-19 21 150S 190E 4304740489 Indian GW APD C
WF 15-21-15-19 21 150S 190E 4304740490 Indian GW APD
WF 4D-22-15-19 22 150S 190E 4304740491 Indian (GW \APD |C
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' a United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PRIDE'+4

CH 35/ Utah State Office INAM ERICA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL 2 8 2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

1FrieldhOfficePriaceFie ce Moa Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Eastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS
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