
EOG Resources, Inc.
P.O. 1910

Vernal, UT 84078

March 28, 2005

Utah Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

RE: APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
EAST CHAPITA 5-5
NE/NE (Lot 1), SEC. 5, T9S, R23E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE NO.: U-01304
FEDERAL LANDS

Enclosed please find a copy of the Application for Permit to Drill and associated
attachments for the referenced well.

Please address further communication regarding this matter (including approval) to:
Ed Trotter
P.O. Box 1910
Vernal, UT 84078
Phone: (435)789-4120
Fax: (435)789-1420

Sincerely,

Ed Trotte
Agent
EOG Resources, Inc.

Attachments

RECEIVED
APRO4 2005

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

East Chapita 5-5



Form 3160-3
FORM APPROVED(April 2004)
OMB No. 1004-0137
Expires March 31, 2007

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT U-01304

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name0 0 1 APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER

7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.la. Type of Work: DRILL MENTER

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Ib. Type of Well: OHWel Gas WeH O Other Single Zone Multiple Zone EAST CHAPITA 5-5
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

EOG RESOURCES, INC.

3a. Address P.O. BOX 1815 3b. Phone No. (Include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
VERNAL, UT 84078 (435)789-0790 NATURAL BUTTES4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk. and Survey or Area

4 0. O'I 035~7
At surface 601' FNL, 631' FEL NE/NE (Lot 1) SEC. 5, TS9, R23E,
At proposed prod. Zone 6 VI 19 S.L.B.& M.

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State
43.95 MILES SOUTHEAST OF VERNAL, UTAH UINTAH UTAH15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this welllocation to nearest 601' 40property or lease line, it 2451(Also to nearest drig. Unit line, if any)

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on fileto nearest well, drilling, completed,
6 NM-2308applied for, on this lease, ft. See Topo Map C 9535

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Esti mated duration
4942.4 FEET GRADED GROUND UPON APPROVAL 45 DAYS

24. Attachments
Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file2. A Drilling Plan. (see Item 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required
by the authorized officer.

25. Signature Name (Printed/Typed) Date
Ed Trotter March 28, 2005

Title

Agent

i cateroved ignature) Name (PEAKiiËEYG.HILL \
pgENVIRONMENTALSCIENTISTIll i '

OfficeTitle

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant toconduct operations thereon.
Conditions of Approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly a 1 lly_tomake to any department or agency of theUnited States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its juris t EIVED
*(Instructions on page 2)

ggÔ Of ÑÊN

kgon is Necessary
DIV.0F0lL,GAS&



EOG RESOURCES INC.T9S R23E S.L.B.&M.1977Brass Cop, ' '
Well location, EAST CHAPITA#5-5, located as

0.1' High, Pile of
stones

shown in the NE 1/4 NE 1/4 (Lot 1) of Section
TBS 38956'38"*-26 **'fs/* 2696"si"*-2623·s"'

5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.Uintoh County, Utah,9ST 1977 Brass Cap, 1977 Brass Cap,0.9' High, Set - 0.4' High, Pile ofstone stones
BASIS OF ELEVATIONEAST CHAP/TA ý'5--5

BENCHMARK (20EAM) LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTIONElev. Ungraded Ground = 4943 631
35, TBS, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SEQUADRANGLE,UTAH,UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE SERIES

LOT 4 LOT 3 LOT 2 LOT 1 (TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATESDEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR,GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAIDELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 4697 FEET.

N5 77 s,...c.1977 Brass Cop,
i 1.J' High, Pi/e of0.4' High, Pile of I

StonesStones

SCALE

CERTIFICATE gnung
THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE ABOVE MFIELDNOTESOF ACTUAL SURVEYS M °ÓÑúÑBSUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME UE AND CORREÒT. T½o BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BE

REGISiRED i,AND UR EYO
REGISTÑATIOgNO. 6 19 'N89°39'W

- 2642.64' (G.L.O.) S89'58'W - 2634.72' (G.L.O.) STATE OF. UTAH

I.INTAH RGINEERING & IAND SJRVEYINGBASIS OF BEARINGS
BS SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

(435) 789--1017LEGEND: (NAD 83)
SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:LATlTUDE= 40°04 13.23" (40.070342) 1" = 1000' 12-1-04 12-30-04

= 90 SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109'20'37.58" (109.343772) PARTY REFERENCES= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. (NAD 27)
G.S. D.L. K.G. G.L.O. PLATLATlTUDE= 40°04'13.36"

(40.070378) WEATHER FILE
A = SECTIONCORNERSLOCATED· LONGITUDE= 109'20'35.13" (109.343092) COLD EOG RESOURCES,



EIGHT POINT PLAN

EAST CHAPITA 5-5
NE/NE, SEC. 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION DEPTH (KB)
Green River 1,961'
Wasatch 4,859'
Chapita Wells 5,412'
Buck Canyon 6,188'
North Horn 7,075'
Island 7,479'
KMV Price River 7,540'
KMV Price River Middle 8,352'
KMV Price River Lower 9,007'
Sego 9,435'

EST. TD: 9,535' Anticipated BHP 4100 PSI

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: 3,000 PSI - BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:
MINIMUM SAFETY FACTOR

HOLE SIZE INTERVAL LENGTH Q WEIGHT GRADE THREAD COLLAPSE BURST TENSILE
20" 0' - 45'+/- GL 45'+/- 13 3/8" 48.0 # H-40 ST&C 770 PSI 1730 PSI 322,000#

12 1/4" 45' - 2300'+/- KB 2300' +/- 9 5/8" 36.0 # J-55 ST&C 2020 PSI 3520 PSI 394,000#
7 7/8" 2300' - TD+/-KB 9535'+/- 4 1/2" 11.6 # N-80 LT&C 6350 PSI 7780 PSI 223,000#

The 12 ¼" Intermediate hole will be drilled to a total depth of 300' below the base of the Green River lost
circulation zone and 9 5/8" casing will be set to that depth. Actual setting depth of the 9 5/8" casing may be less
than 2300' in this well.
All casing will be new or inspected.

5. Float Equipment:

CONDUCTOR HOLE PROCEDURE (0-45' Below GL):
None

SURFACE HOLE PROCEDURE (45'-2300'):
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Cents.: 1-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5thjOinÍÍO SurfaCO.

PRODUCTION HOLE PROCEDURE 2300'-TD:
FS, 1 joint of casing, FC, and balance of casing to surface. ,

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

EAST CHAPITA 5-5
NE/NE, SEC. 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

6. MUD PROGRAM

CONDUCTOR HOLE PROCEDURE (0-45' Below GL):
Dry or light mud as needed to support drilling by Bucket Rig.

SURFACE HOLE PROCEDURE (45'-2300'):
Air, Air Mist and Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

PRODUCTION HOLE PROCEDURE 2300'-TD:
2300'- 4500' Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

4500'- 6900' Close in mud system. "Mud up" with 6.0 pub Diammonium Phosphate (DAP). Drill
with DAP water, POLYPLUS for viscosity and hole cleaning, adding KLA-GARD B for
supplemental inhibition. Also sweep hole periodically w/ Durogel / LCM sweeps to
clean the hole and seal loss zones. Add additional LCM as hole dictates. Mud weight
and vis as needed water loss - no control. .

6900'- TD Discontinue KLA-GARD B. Utilize POLYPAC-R for fluid loss control. Maintain 5.5
p_gb.DAP. Do not mix caustic or lime. Maintain 7.5-8.5 pH. Weight up system ai
add vis as hole conditions require. Run LCM sweep periodically to seal off loss zones or
more often as hole dictates. Water loss: 20 cc's maximum. Expect increasing gas shows
requiring heavier mud weights from top of Island onward. Treat CO2 contamination with
DESCO CF and OSIL (Oxygen scavenger) if mud properties dictate.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:
A. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring a straight run blooie line (Where

possible, a straight run blooie line will be used).

B. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring an automatic ignitor or
continuous pilot light on the blooie line. (Not required on aerated water system).

C. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiŠing the blooie line to be 100' in length.
To reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be 75' in length.

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:

Logs: No Open Hole Logs.
Cased Hole Logs will to run.

8 point plan-EOG
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

EAST CHAPITA 5-5
NE/NE, SEC. 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:
CONDUCTOR HOLE PROCEDURE (0-45' Below GL):
Cement to surface with Redi-Mix cement

SURFACE HOLE PROCEDURE (45'-2300'+/-):

Option #1: Well circulates or drills with air.
Tail: 500' of Class 'G' mixed at 15.8ppg w/ 2% CaCl2 & 0.25 pps Flocele + 35% Excess or
Type 5 Cement mixed at 15.6 ppg w/ 2% CaCl2 & 0.25 pps Flocele + 35% Excess.

Lead: Hi-Fill Cement mixed at 11 ppg with 16% Gel, 10#/sx Gilsonite, 3% salt, 3#/sx GR-3
and 0.25 #/sx Flocele plus 35% Excess to get cement returns to surface.

Option #2: Well does not circulate.
Class 'G' cement mixed at 15.8 ppg w/ 2% CaCl2 & 0.25 pps Flocele + 35% Excess or Type % 5
Cement mixed at 15.6 ppg w/ 2% CaCl2 & 0.25 pps Flocele + 35% Excess to 100' above the lost
circulation zone and top out with same with 3-4% CaCl2 to get cement returns to surface.

PRODUCTION HOLE PROCEDURE 2300'-TD:
Lead: 110 sks 35:65 Poz G w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% DI74 (Extender), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),

0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% Dl12 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.15% D13 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29
(cello flakes), mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.73 cu. ft./sk., 9.06 gps water

Tail: 190 sks: 50:50 Poz G w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.15% D13 (Retarder),
0.2% Dl67 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 cu. ft./sk., 5.9
gps water.

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

SURFACE HOLE (45'-2300')

Potential Problems: Lost circulation below 1800' and minor amounts of gas may be present.

PRODUCTION HOLE 2300'-TD

Potential Problems: Sloughing shales and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch
Formation. CO2contamination in the mud is possible in the Price River (Mesa
Verde).

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

EAST CHAPITA 5-5
NE/NE, SEC. 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.
Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG



3000 PSIG DIAGRAM

ANNULAR PREVENTOR AND BOTH RAMS ARE 3000 PSIG RATED.
SING FLOANGEIGS11" 3000 PSIG RATED. ROTATING HEAD

TESTING PROCEDURE: \ / FLOW LINE1. BOPE's will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2 '
( )

with retest every 14 days.
2. Blind & Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 3000 psig. I I
3. Annular preventor will be tested to 50% of working pressure, 1500psig.
4. Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi/ft. or 1500 psig. Not to exceed 70% of burst ANNULAR

strength, whichever is greater. PREVENTER
5. All lines subject to well pressure will be pressure-tested to the same pressure as

blind & pipe rams.
6. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2 l l

requirements for 3000 psig BOPE specifications.

PIPE RAMSCHOKE MANIFOLD
2" MIN ADJUSTABLE CHOKE

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR
OR PIT

, BLIND RAMS
A 3" MINIMUM RATED O

3000 PSIG
3" MINIMUM 2" KILL LINE

BLEED LINE TO PIT 3" DIAMETER

CASING
2" MINIMUM FLANG

SPOOL 11" 3000 PSIG0 0 ŒH
TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR ADJUSTABLE CHOKE
OR PIT (Note: Blind Rams may be installed above or below the pipe
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CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
FOR THE SURFACE USE PROGRAM OF THE

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
Well Name & Number: East Chapita 5-5
Lease Number: U-01304
Location: 601' FNL & 631' FEL, NE/NE (Lot 1), Sec. 5,

T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M., Uintah County, Utah
Surface Ownership: Federal

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction
of location and access roads.

Location Completion - prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Spud Notice: - at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to
spudding the well.

Casing String and
Cementing - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and cementing all casing strings.

BOP and related
Equipment Tests - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and tests.

First Production
Notice - within five (5) business days after new

Well begins or production resumes after
Well has been off production for more
than ninety (90) days.

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of
Approval for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

East Chapita 5-5 D



0 O

THIRTEEN POINT SURFACE USE PROGRAM

1. EXISTING ROADS

A. See attached Wellsite Plats showing directional reference stakes on location,
and attached TOPO Map "B" showing access to location from existing roads.

B. The proposed well site is located approximately 43.95 miles southeast of
Vernal, Utah - See attached TOPO Map "A".

C. Refer to attached Topographic Map "A" showing labeled access route to
location.

D. Existing roads will be maintained and repaired as necessary. No off lease
Right-of-Way will be required.

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROAD

A. The access road will be approximately 0.9 miles in length. See attached
TOPO Map "B".

B. The access road has a 30 foot ROW w/ 18 foot running surface.
C. Maximum grade on access road will be 8%.
D. No turnouts will be required.
E. Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing

type.
F. No culverts, bridges, or major cuts and fills will be required.
G. The access road will be dirt surface.
H. No gates, cattleguards, or fences will be required or encountered.

New or reconstructed roads will be centerlined - flagged at time of location
staking.

The road shall be upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated traffic flow
and all-weather road requirements. Upgrading shall include ditching, drainage, graveling,
crowning, and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well-constructed safe road.
Prior to upgrading, the road shall be cleared of any snow cover and allowed to dry
completely. Traveling off the 30 foot Right-of-Way will not be allowed.

Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing type.
Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause siltation or accumulation of debris in
the drainage crossings nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Erosion of
drainage ditches by run off water shall be prevented by diverting water off at frequent
intervals by means of cutouts. Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions.
Should mud holes develop, they shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.

As operator, EOG Resources, Inc. shall be responsible for all maintenance on
cattleguards, or gates associated with this oil and/or gas operation.

East Chapita 5-5 D



O O

3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A ONE MILE RADIUS OF
PROPOSED WELL LOCATION

A. Producing wells -
1*

(*See attached TOPO map "C" for location)

4. LOCATION OF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED FACILITIES

A. ON WELL PAD

1. Production facilities will be set on location if the well is successfully
completed for production. Facilities will consist of wellhead valves,
combo separator-dehy unit with meter, 300 Bbl vertical or 200 Bbl low
profile, condensate tank, and attaching piping.

2. Gas gathering lines - A 4" gathering line will be buried from dehy to
the edge of the location.

B. OFF WELL PAD

1. Proposed location of attendant off pad flowlines shall be flagged prior
to archaeological clearance.

2. A 4" OD steel above ground natural gas pipeline will be laid
approximately 5492' from proposed location to a point in the SW/NW
of Section 5, T9S, R23E, where it will tie into QuestarPipeline Co.'s
existing line. Proposed pipeline crosses Federal lands, thus a Right-of
-Way grant will be required.

3. Proposed pipeline will be a 4" OD steel, welded line laid on the
surface.

4. Protective measures and devices for livestock and wildlife will be
taken and/or installed where required.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the well pad shall be surrounded by a containment dike
of sufficient capacity to contain, at a minimum, the entire contents of the
largest tank within the facility/battery.

The production facilities will be placed on the Northeast side of the
location.

All permanent (on site for six months or longer) structures constructed or
installed (including pumping units) will be painted a flat, non-reflective,
earthtone color to match one of the standard environmental colors, as
determined by the Rocky Mountain Five State Interagency Committee.
All facilities will be painted within 6 months of installation. Facilities

East Chapita 5-5 D
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required to comply with O.S.H.A. (Occupational Safety and Health Act)
will be excluded.

The required paint color is Carlsbad Canyon.

If at any time the facilities located on public land and authorized by the
terms of the lease are no longer included in the lease (due to a contraction
in the unit or other lease or unit boundary change), BLM will process a
change in authorization to the appropriate statute. The authorization will
be subject to appropriate rental or other financial obligation as determined
by the authorized officer.

5. LOCATION & TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

A. Water supply will be from Ouray Municipal Water Plant at Ouray, Utah,
and/or Target Trucking Inc.'s water source in the SW/SW, Sec. 35, T9S,
R22E, Uintah County, Utah (State Water Right #49-1501). Produced water
from the Chapita Wells and Stagecoach Units will also be used.

B. Water will be hauled by a licensed trucking company.
C. No water well will be drilled on lease.

6. SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL

A. All construction material for this location and access road will be of native
borrow and soil accumulated during the construction of the location.

B. All construction material will come from Federal Land.
C. No mineral materials will be required.

7. METHODS OF HANDLING WASTE DISPOSAL

A. METHODS AND LOCATION
1. Cuttings will be confined in the reserve pit.
2. A portable toilet will be provided for human waste during the drilling

and completion of the well. Disposal will be at the Vernal sewage
disposal plant.

3. Burning will not be allowed. Trash and other waste material will be
contained in a wire mesh cage and disposed of at the Uintah County
Landfill.

4. Produced wastewater will be confined to a lined pit or storage tank for
a period not to exceed 90 days after initial production. After the 90
day period, the produced water will be contained in a tank on location
and then disposed of at one of the following three locations: Natural
Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD, Ace Disposal, or EOG Resources, Inc.
drilling operations (Chapita Wells Unit, Natural Buttes Unit &
Stagecoach Unit).

East Chapita 5-5 D
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5. All chemicals will be disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Drip

pans and absorbent pads will be used on the drilling rig to avoid
leakage of oil to the pit.

B. Water from drilling fluids and recovered during testing operations will be
disposed of by either evaporating in the reserve pit or be removed and
disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Introduction of well bore
hydrocarbons to the reserve pit will be avoided by flaring them off in the flare
pit at the time of recovery.

On BLM administered land:
The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.
If the reserve pit requires padding prior to lining (due to rocky conditions) felt
padding will be used.

The reserve pit shall be lined with a plastic liner. A felt liner will also be
installed if rock is encountered during pit construction.

8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES
A. No airstrips or camps are planned for this well.

9. WELLSITE LAYOUT
A. Refer to attached well site plat for related topography cuts and fills and

cross sections.
B. Refer to attached well site plat for rig layout and soil material stockpile

location as approved on On-site.
C. Refer to attached well site plat for rig orientation, parking areas, and

access road.
D. The approved seed mixture for this location is:

Four-Wing Salt Bush - 3 pounds per acre
Indian Rice Grass - 2 pounds per acre
Needle and Thread Grass - 2 pounds per acre
Hi-Crest Crested Wheat Grass - 1 pound per acre.

The reserve pit will be located on the West side of the location. The flare
pit will be located downwind of the prevailing wind direction on the West
side of the location, a minimum of 100 feet from the well head and 30 feet
from the reserve pit fence.
The stockpiled pit topsoil will be stored separate from the location topsoil
Northeast of Corners B and 5. The stockpiled location topsoil will be
stored Southwest of Corner #6. Upon completion of construction, the
stockpiled topsoil from the location will be broadcast seeded with the
approved seed mixture for this location and then walked down with a
Caterpiller tractor.

East Chapita 5-5 D



O O

Access to the well pad will be from the Southwest.

Corners #2, #6, & #8 will be rounded off to minimize excavation.

FENCING REQUIREMENTS:

All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

A. Thirty-nine inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of barbed wire
on top of the net wire. (Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of
reinforcement rod is attached to the top of the entire fence).

B. The net wire shall be no more than 2 inches above the ground. The barbed
wire strand shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence
shall be at least 42 inches.

C. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner as to keep the
fence tight at all times.

D. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

E. All wire shall be stretched by using a stretching device before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on the three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until clean-up.

Each existing fence to be crossed by the access road shall be braced and tied off
before cutting so as to prevent slacking of the wire. The opening shall be closed
temporarily as necessary during construction to prevent the escape of livestock,
and, upon completion of construction, the fence shall be repaired to BLM or SMA
specifications. A cattleguard with an adjacent 16 foot gate shall be installed in
any fence where a road is to be regularly traveled. If the well is a producer, the
cattleguards (shall/shall not) be permanently mounted on concrete bases. Prior to
crossing any fence located on Federal land, or any fence between Federal land and
private land, the operator will contact the BLM, who will in turn contact the
grazing permittee or owner of said fence and offer him/her the opportunity to be
present when the fence is cut in order to satisfy himself/herself that the fence is
adequately braced and tied off.

10. PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE

A. PRODUCING LOCATION
Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash, and junk not
required for production.

East Chapita 5-5 D
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Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be
removed in accordance with CFR 3162.7-1.
If a plastic nylon reinforced liner is used, it shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production
facilities/operations will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours.
The stockpiled pit topsoil will then be spread over the pit area and broadcast
seeded with the prescribed seed mixture for this location. The seeded area will
then be walked down with a cat.

B. DRY HOLE/ABANDONED LOCATION

At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator will submit a
subsequent report of abandonment and the BLM will attach the appropriate
surface rehabilitation conditions of approval.

11. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
Access road: Federal
Location: Federal

12. OTHER INFORMATION
A. EOG Resources, Inc. will inform all persons in the area who are associated

with this project that they are subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing
historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or
archaeological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator will
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials, and contact
the AO. Within five working days the AO will inform the operator as to:

• whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of
Historic Places;

• the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake
before the site can be used.

• a time frame for the AO to complete an expedited review under 36
CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation
Officer, that the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation
is appropriate.

If the operator wished, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the
expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with this process, the
AO will assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization
of the exposed materials that may be required. Otherwise, the operator
will be responsible for mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical
and procedural guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification
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from the AO that required mitigation has been completed, the operator will
then be allowed to resume construction.

B. As operator, EOG Resources, Inc. will control noxious weeds
along Right-of-Ways for roads, pipelines, well sites, or other applicable
facilities. A list of noxious weeds will be obtained from the BLM, or the
appropriate County Extension Office. On BLM administered land, a
Pesticide Use proposal shall be submitted, and given approval, prior to the
application of herbicides or other pesticides or possible hazardous
chemicals.

C. Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this well
site will not be stacked or stored on BLM lands after the conclusion of
drilling operations or at any other time without BLM authorization.
However, if BLM authorization is obtained, it is only a temporary measure
to allow time to make arrangements for permanent storage on commercial
facilities. (The BLM does not seek to compete with private industry.
There are commercial facilities available for stacking and storing drilling
rigs.)

Additional Surface Stipulations
X

_
No construction or drilling activities shall be conducted between May 15 and
June 20 because of Antelope Stipulations.

LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION

PERMITTING AGENT DRILLING OPERATIONS
Ed Trotter Donald Presenkowski
P.O. Box 1910 EOG Resources, Inc.
Vernal, UT 84078 P.O. Box 250
Telephone: (435)789-4120 Big Piney, WY 83113
Fax: (435)789-1420 Telephone: (307)276-4865

All lease or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approval
plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees. EOG Resources, Inc. is fully
responsible for the actions of their subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be
furnished to the field representative to insure compliance.

A copy of the approved APD and ROW grant, if applicable, shall be on location during
construction of the location and drilling activities.

East Chapita 5-5 D
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Certification

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drillsite and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions that presently
exist; that the statements made in the Plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by EOG Resources, Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this Plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved.

Please be advised that EOG Resources, Inc. is considered to be the operator of the South
Chapita 5-5 Well, located in the NE/NE (Lot 1) of Section 5, T9S, R23E, Uintah
County, Utah; Lease #U-01304; and is responsible under the terms and conditions of
the lease for the operations conducted upon the leased lands. Bond Coverage is provided
under Bond #NM 2308.

Date Agent

East Chapita 5-5 D
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.
EAST CHAPITA #5-5

SECTION 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL,
UTAH ALONG U.S. HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 3.9 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF STATE HIGHWAY 45; EXIT RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 19.2
MILES ON STATE HIGHWAY 45 TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHWEST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHWESTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 13.0
MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
SOUTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN
NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 2.4 MILES TO THE
.TUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO EAST; TURN RIGHT
AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY, THEN NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.8 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF
THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND
PROCEED IN A NORTHEASTERLY, THEN EASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 1.3 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.2 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE NORTHEAST;
TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.4 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN AN
EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATLEY 1.0 MILES TO THE BEGINNING OF
THE PROPOSED ACCESS FOR THE #662-6 TO THE SOUTHEAST; FOLLOW
ROAD FLAGS IN A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.2
MILES TO THE BEGINNING OF THE PROPOSED ACESS FOR THE #2-5 TO THE
SOUTHEAST; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN A SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN
EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATLEY 0.15 MILES TO THE BEGINNING OF
THE PROPOSED ACCESS TO THE NORTHEAST; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN A
NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0:9 MILES TO THE
PROPOSEITLOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 43.95
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.

EAST CHAPITA #5-5
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHEASTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHEASTERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATION PHOTOs 12 02 04 PHOTO
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 iblONTH DAY YEAR

- Since 1964 -

435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com TAKENBY:G.S. DRAWNBY:C.H. REVISED:



EOG RESOURCES, INC.
LOCATION LAYOUTFOR

EAST CHAPITA #5--5
SECTION 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

601' FNL 631' FEL Existing
Appr

pe -

•

Drainage

SCALE: 1" = 50'
6

E/. 34.8'

DATE: 12-30-04 65'
Drawn By· K.G.

C-1.9'
O. 44.J' Round Corners

as needed

NOTE
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Ÿ
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rwr er ( E/. 45.6'
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29 36
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DOG HOUSE
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TOOLS

FUEL
---- STORAGE

Sto. 0+13 TR SH -o E-6.4i TANK

E/. J6. O'
S Ok2

20' WE BEHCH 4

E/. 44.9' --- µ_7. g' E-6.0
C-14.5' B. 40.5' E/. J6.4

""·
RNA Reserve Pit Backfi// Proposed AccessSpol/s Stockpse Road

FIGURE #1ÍElev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Stoke = 4943. J' I I
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINGF/N/SHED GRADE ELEl/ AT LOC. STAxe = 4942.4 es so. zoo s2se - v-z. era swore • rass>



e eEOG RESOURCES, INC· FIGURE #2
TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR

X-section EAST CHAPITA #5-5
scale SECTION 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

,, , 601' FNL 631' FEL
1 = 50

DATE: 12-30-04
Drawn By K.G.

65' 135'
Preconstruction
Grade

S M. J+25

126' 135'

S M. 1+50

15'- 75' 36' 135'

Slope= 1 1/2: 1

126' 135°

NOTE:
Topsoil should not be * NOTE
Stripped Below Finished SM. 0+00 F/LL QUANT/TYINCLUDES

SX FOR COMPACTIONGrade on Substructure Area.

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = J,2]O Cu. Yds.
Topsoil & Pit Backfill = J,2JO Cu. Yds.

CUT (1/2 Pit Vol.)
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,570 Cu. Yds.

EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu.Yds.Rernaining Location = 5,930 Cu. Yds (After Rehabilitation)

TOTAL CUT = 7,500 CU.YDS.
FILL = 4,270 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

86 So, 200 ßest * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435)
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PROPOSED LOCATION:
EAST CHAPITA #1-5

0.3 MI. +/- T 8 3
SEE TOPt "B"

0.5 MI. +l- T9S

C

C AP A GAS

E
LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.

PROPOSED LOCATION N EAST CHAPITA #5-5
SECTION 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

601' FNL 631' FEL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 12 02 04
85 South 200 East Vernal, TJtah 84078 M A P ONTH DAY YEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE:1:100,000 DRAWNBY:C.H. ISED:00-00-00
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PROPOSED LOCATION:
E HAP 5-5

111 11 a. 43 L.u m..
VERNAL 42.7 MI. +/. CWU T9S651

PROPOSED ACCESS
FOR THE # 6 0

6

PROPOSED ACCESS
FOR THE #2-5 0.2 MI. +/-

LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
EXISTINGROAD N EAST CHAPITA #5-5

------------ PROPOSEDACCESSROAD SECTION 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
601' FNL 631' FEL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 12 O 04
85 South 200 East Vernal, IJtah 84078 M A P MONT DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1" = 2000' DRAWNBY:C.H. REVISED:



PROPOSED LOCATION:

LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
pr DISPOSAL WELLS WATER WELLs N EAST CHAPITA #5-5
e PRODUCINGWELLS ABANDONED WELLs SECTION 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

SHUT IN WELLS -#- TEMPORARILY ABANDONED 601' FNL 631' FEL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 12
¯02

0485 South 200 East Vernal, TJtah 84078 i Á Ÿ ONT DAY VEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1" = 2000' DRAWNBY:C.H. REVISED:
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4932,

o PROPOSED LOCATION: ----

EAST CHAPITA #5-5 T8S
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#65t-6

CW #66 6 0 .co

owu 42-6
. 4

. ,

4900 .

o PROPOSED PIPELINE
F HE #2-5

o .

0 .

APPROXIMATE TOTAL PIPELINE DISTANCE = 5492' +/-

LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD N EAST CHAPITA #5-5

-------- EXISTINGPIPELINE SECTION 5, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
----------- PROPOSED PIPELINE

601' FNL 631'



WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 04/04/2005 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-36490

WELL NAME: E CHAPITA S-5

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC ( N9550 )

CONTACT: ED TROTTER PHONE NUMBER: 435-789-4120

PROPOSED LOCATION:

NENE 05 090S 230E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SURFACE: 0601 FNL 0631 FEL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 0601 FNL 0631 FEL

UINTAH Engineering

NATURAL BUTTES ( 630 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface
LEASE NUMBER: U-01304

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal
LATITUDE: 40.07036

PROPOSED FORMATION: PRRV

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.3431

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

3/ Plat R649-2-3. yg
,/ Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]

Unit BADLANDS
(No. NM-2308 )

A Potash (Y/N)
p/^ R649-3-2. General

I Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or .190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

V Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No.49-1501 )

Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No:(Date: )
Eff Date:

LÍ.W Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS: JO
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FEDERAL4931

BADLANDS UNIT
FEDERAL 24·33

BADLANDSFED1-32 X
FEDERAL M-31

TSS R23E
S R23E

ECHAPfTAM

CWU651·6

CAUSE:179·8

CHAPITA WELLSUNIT
I

I

6 S

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD
ewome

X

\

OPERATOR- EOG RESOURCES INC (N9550)

SEC.5 T.9S R.23E

FIELD:NATURAL BUTTES (630)

COUNTY:UINTAH

SPACING:R669-3-2/GENERALS

shP Relds.shp UtahOilGas and Mining
A GASINJECHON EXPLORATORY ABANDONED
© GAS STORAGE GAS STORAGE ACTIVE
× LOCATION ABANDONED

NEW LOCATION NF PF OIL COMBINED

+ PLUGGED & ABANDONED NF SECONDARY INACTIVE

A PRODUCING GAS PENDING PROPOSED
e raovocING OIL PI OIL STORAGE
+ SHUT-IN GAS PP GAS

___

TERMINATED
+ SHUT-IN OIL --

PP GEOTHERML 5X TEMP. ABANDONED
o TEST WELL PP OIL

& WATER INJECTION SECONDARY
+ WATER SUPPLy TERMINATED PREPARED BY:DIANA WHITNEY
X WATER DISPOS g DATE:
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JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.

Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah
June 16, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER EOG Resources, Inc.
Executive Director PO Box 1815

. . . Vernal, UT 84078Dmslon of
Oil, Gas & Mining

JOHN R. BAZA Re: East Chapita 5-5 Well, 601' FNL, 631' FEL, NE NE, Sec. 5, T. 9 South,
Division Director

R. 23 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36490.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Acting Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah CountyAssessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594 West NorthTemple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt LakeCity, UT 84114-5801
telephone(801) 538-5340•facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 •
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Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
Well Name & Number East Chapita 5-5

API Number: 43-047-36490
Lease: U-01304

Location: NE NE Sec. 5 T. 9 South R. 23 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the



Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) OMB No. 1004-0137

Expires March 31, 2007
UNITED STATES

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT U-01304
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER

la. Type of Work: DRILL REENTER
7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

8. Lease Name and Well No.

Ib. Type of Well: OHWell Gas Well Other Si e Sne Multiple 2one EAST CHAPITA 5-5

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

EOG RESOURCES, INC. APR I 2005

3a. Address P.O. BOX 1815 yeN1Ûnçludarea code 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

VERNAL, UT 84078 'Í8TU79W NATURAL BUTTES
4. Location of Well {Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk. and Survey or Area

At surface 601' FNL, 631' FEL NEINE (Lot 1) SEC. 5, TS9, R23E,
At proposed prod. Zone S.L.B.&M.

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

43.95 MILES SOUTHEAST OF VERNAL, UTAH UINTAH UTAH
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well

location to nearest 601' 40property or lease line, ft. 2461
(Also to.nearest drig. Unit line, if any)

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, drilling, completed, NM-2308
applied for, onthis lease, ft. See Topo Map C 9535

21. Élevations(Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Esti mated duration

4942.4 FEET GRADED GROUND UPON APPROVAL 45 DAYS
24. Attachments

Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file
2. A Drilling Plan. (see Item 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filedwith the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required
by the authorized officer.

I I

25. Signature Name (Printed/Typed) Date

Ed Trotter March 28, 2005

Title
Agent

Ap y (Signa ) Name (Printed/Typed) Date
I I

Ti SISIS ÌG 80899¶ Omce

Mineramesources
I

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to
conduct operations thereon.
Conditions of Approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any de artment or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or
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Well # East Chapita 5-5

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

CompanylOperator: EOG Resources, Inc.

Well Name & Number: East Chapita 5-5

Lease Number: U-01304

API Number: 43-047-36490

Location: Lot 1 Sec. _5_ T.9S_ R. 23E

Agreement: N/A

For more specific details on notificationrequirements, please check the Conditions of Approval
for Notice to Drilland Surface Use Program.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR NOTICE TO DRILL

Approval of thisapplication does not warrant or certifythat the applicant holds legal or equitable
titleto those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well is
being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

1. Estimated Depth at Which Oil, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearinq Zones are
Expected to be Encountered

Report g water shows and water-bearing sands to John Mayers of thisoffice prior to setting
the next casing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies of State of Utah form
OGC-8-Xare acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected, submit samples to this office
along with any water analyses conducted.

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLMat onsite)
encountered during drilling, will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. Alloiland gas
shows willbe tested to determine commercial potential.

2. Pressure Control Equipment

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimumrequirements of Onshore Oiland Gas
Order No. 2 for equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc., for a _3_NIsystem and
individual components shall be operable as designed. Chart recorders shall be used for all
pressure tests.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while drilling
and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.
The blooie line variances requested in section 7 of the APD are granted onlywhen conditions of
the well pad will not allowa straight line that extends 100' from the
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Well # East Chapita 5-5

3. Casinq Program and Auxiliary Equipment

Surface casing shall have centralizers on the bottom three joints, witha minimumof one
centralizer per joint. Surface casing setting depths are based on ground level elevations only.

Allcasing strings below the conductor shall be pressure tested to 0.22 psilft of casing string
length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater but not to exceed 70% of the minimuminternal yield.

As a minimumrequirement, the cement behind to production casing must extend at least 200'
above the top of the Wasatch Formation which has been identified at ±4756'.

Ifgilsonite is encountered while drilling, it shall be isolated and/or protected via the cementing
program.

4. Mud Program and Circulatinq Medium

Hazardous substances specifically listed by the EPA as a hazardous waste or demonstrating a
characteristic of a hazardous waste willnot be used in drilling, testing,or completion operations.

No chromate additives willbe used.in the mud system on Federal and Indian lands without prior
BLMapproval to ensure adequate protection of fresh water aquifers.

5. Corinq, Loqqinq and Testinq Proqram

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to this office on a weekly basis.

A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to top of the cement and
shall be utilizedto determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of
the CBL to thisoffice.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) willbe submitted not later than 30 days after
completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with43
CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data, geologic
summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the
drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, will be filed with Form 3160-4. Samples
(cuttings, fluids, and/or gases) will be submitted when requested by the AO.

Please submit an electronic copy of all logs run on this well in LAS format. This
submission will supersede the requirement for submittal of paper logs to the BLM. The
cement bond log must be submitted in raster format (TIF, PDF or other).

6. Notifications of Operations

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior approval
of the AO. Ifoperations are to be suspended, prior approval of the AO willbe obtained and
notificationgiven before resumption of operations.

Operator shall report production data to MMS pursuant to 30 CFR 216.5 using form
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Well # East Chapita 5-5

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual occurrences
shall be promptly reported in accordance with the requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

Ifa replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "Sundry Notice" (Form 3160-5)
to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved plan
are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.

The date on which production is commenced or resumed willbe construed for oilwells as the
date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporarystorage facility,
such as a test tank, and for which a run ticketis required to be generated or, the date on which
liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent storage facility, whichever first occurs;
and, for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped
from a temporarystorage facility, such as a test tank,and for which a run ticket is required to be
generated or, the date on which gas is first measured through permanent metering facilities,
whichever first occurs.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO willbe notifiedwhen the well
is placed in a producing status. Written notificationof such must be submitted to this office not
later than five (5) days following the date on which the well is placed on production.

Gas produced from thiswell may not be vented or flared beyond an initial authorized test period
of 30 days or 50 MMCF following its completion, whichever occurs first, without the prior written
approval of the Authorized Officer. Should gas be vented or flared withoutapproval beyond the
authorized test period, the operator may be directed to shut-in the well untilthe gas can be
captured or approval to continue venting or flaring as uneconomic is granted and the operator
shall be required to compensate the lessor for that portion of the gas vented or flared without
approval which is determined to have been avoidably lost.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5(d) shall be submitted to the
appropriate Field Office within60 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs first.
Allsite security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be adhered to.
All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectivelysealed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (1).

No well abandonment operations willbe commenced without the prior approval of the AO. In
the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergencies, oral approval will be obtained
from the AO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be filed with the AO
within thirty(30) days following completion of the well for abandonment. This report will indicate
where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Final abandonment will
not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by the approved APD or approved
abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his representative, or
the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.

7. Other Information

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.

Alloff-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or comminglingonlease or off-lease willhave prior
written approval from the
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Well # East Chapita 5-5

The oil and gas measurement facilities willbe installed on the well location. The oiland gas
meters willbe calibrated in place prior to any deliveries and tested for meter accuracy at least
quarterly thereafter. The AO willbe provided witha date and time for the initial meter calibration
and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be submitted
to the Vernal District Office. Allmeter measurement facilities willconform with Onshore Oil &
Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas
measurement.

The use of materials under BLMjurisdictionwillconform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover program without prior
approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Allwells,
whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned willbe identified in accordance with 43
CFR 3162.

"Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) willbe filed for approval for all changes of
plans and other operations in accordance with43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982, as implemented
by the applicable provisions of the operating regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(c), requires
that "not later than the 5th business day after any well begins production on which royaltyis due
anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site, or resumes production in the case of a well
which has been off production for more than 90 days, the operator shall notifythe authorized
officer by letter or sundry notice, Form 3160-5, or orally to be followed by a letter or sundry
notice, of the date on which such production has begun or resumed."

Ifyou fail to complywith this requirement in the manner and timeallowed, you shall be liable for
a civilpenalty of up to $10,000per violationfor each day such violation continues, not to exceed
a maximum of 20 days. See Section 109(c)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management
Act of 1982 and the implementing regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(ii).

APD approval is valid for a period of one (1) year from the signature date. An extension period
may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the originalapproval period.

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Michael Lee (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435)
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Well # East Chapita 5-5

EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPT EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, theyare not necessarily hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids
Gas plant cooling tower cleaning wastes

Painting wastes
Oil and gas service company wastes, such as empty drums, drum rinsate, vacuum truck rinsate,
sandblast media, painting wastes, spend solvents, spilled chemicals, and waste acids

Vacuum truckand drum rinsate from trucksand drums, transportingor containing nonexempt
waste

Refinery wastes
Liquid and solid wastes generated by crude oiland tank bottom reclaimers
Used equipment lubrication oils

Waste compressor oil, filters, and blowdown

Used hydraulic fluids

Waste solvents
Waste in transportationpipeline-related pits

Caustic or acid cleaners

Boiler cleaning wastes

Boiler refractory bricks

incinerator ash
Laboratory wastes
Sanitary wastes

Pesticide wastes
Radioactive tracer wastes
Drums, insulation and miscellaneous
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Well # East Chapita 5-5

Company/Operator: EOG Resources Inc..

API Number 43-047-36490

Well Name & Number: East Chapita 5-5

Lease number: UTU-01304

Location: SWSE Sec, 5 T.9S. R. 23E.

Surface Ownership: BLM

Date NOS Received: 1/19/05

Date APD Received: 4/12/05

Conditions for Approval are in the APD

1. Within 90 calendar days of the approval date for thisApplication for Permit to Drill(APD), the
operator/lessee shall submit to the Authorized Officer (AO), on Sundry Notice Form 3160-5, an
Interim Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on well pads, access roads, and
pipelines. At a minimum,thiswould include the reshaping of the pad to the originalcontour to
the extent possible; the respreading of the top soil up to the rig anchor points; and, the area
reseeded using appropriate reclamation methods. The AO will provide written approval or
concurrence within 30 calendar days of receipt.

2. As a Best Management Practice (BMP), the pipeline would be buried within the identified
construction width of an access corridorthat contains the access road and pipelines.
Exceptions to this BMP may be granted where laterally extensive, hard indurated bedrock, such
as sandstone, is at or within 2 feet of the surface; and, soil types with a poor history of
successful rehabilitation).

3. Prior to abandonment of a buried pipeline, the operator would obtain authorization from the
appropriate regulatory agency. BLMwilldetermine whether the pipeline and all above ground
pipeline facilities shall be removed and unsalvageable materials disposed of at approved sites or
abandoned in place. Reshaping and revegetation of disturbed land areas will be completed
where necessary.

4. During interim management of the surface, use the following seed mix:
9 Ibs of Hycrest Crested Wheatgrass and 3 lbs of Kochia prostrate.

5. To clear this proposed project, the access road and buried pipeline would need to be
monitored by a certified paleontologist, Ifany vertebrate fossils are found during construction,
work would cease and the paleontologist would evaluate the



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
U-01304

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnewwells, significantly deepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER EAST CHAPITA 5-05

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.AP1NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-36490
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX 1815 VERNAL STATE UT zi,84078 (435) 789-0790 NATURAL BUTTES
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 601 FNL 631 FEL 40.070342 LAT 109.343772 LON COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENE 5 9S 23E S.L.B. & M STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: APD EXTENSION
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION REQUEST

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests the APD for the referenced well be extended for one year.

. Approved by the 'l
Utah Division of

=

Oil, Gas and Miníng

Date: "

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) K ne R. ardner TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATUR DATE 6/15/2006

(This space for State use nly) RECEIVED
JUNi 6 2006

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DN.OF0\L,GAS&



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-36490

Well Name: EAST CHAPITA 5-05

Location: 601 FNL 631 FEL (NENE), SECTION 34, T9S, R23E S.L.B.&M
Company Permit Issued to: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
Date Original Permit Issued: 6/16/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Followinq is a checklist of some items related to the application,which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONoO

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO Nom

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesO Nom

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesO No O

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? YesO NoO

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which will require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesO NoO

Is bonding still in place, which covers thisproposed well? YesŒNoO

6/15/2006

ure Date

Title: REGULATORY ASSISTANT

Representing: EOG RESOURCES, INC.

RECE¡VED
JUN162006

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



Fonn 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTEILIOR ÑÊÙÌ3, 007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMiNT 5. LeaseSerialNo

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U 3 4

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,All

abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse sidB. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

l. Type of
ilWell GasWell Other 8. Well Nameand No.

2. NameofOperator EAST CHAPITA 5-5
EOG RESOURCES, INC' 9. API We11No.

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 43-047-36490

1060 East Highway 40, Vernal, UT 84078 435-781-9111 10.FieldandPool,or ExploratoryArea
4. LocationofWell (Footage, Sec.,T.,R.,M, orSurveyDescnption) NATURAL BUTTES

601 FNL 631 FEL (NENE) S.L.B.&M 11. Countyor Parish, State

SECTION 5, T9S, R23E 40.070342 LAT 109.343772 LON UINTAH COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATE NATURE OFNDIKE REPORT, OR OIHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Production(StadResume) Water Shut-OK
Noticeof Intent AlterCasing FractureTreat Reclamation WellIntegrity

SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other APD RENEWAL

ChangePlans Plug andAbandon TemporarilyAbandon
FinalAbandonment Notice Convertto Injection PlugBack WaterDisposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearlystateallpertinentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdateof anyproposedwork andapproximatedurationthereof
If theproposalisto deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasured and truevertical depthsofallpertinentmarkersandzones.
AttachtheBond under which thework will beperformedorprovidetheBond No. on filewith BLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequentreports shallbefiledwithin 30days
followingcompletionoftheinvolvedoperations.If theoperationresultsina multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval,a Form31604 shallbefiledonce
testinghasbeencompleted.Final Abandonment Notices shallbefiledonlyafterall requirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted,andtheoperatorhas
determinedthatthesiteis ready forfinalinspection.)

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests the referenced APD originally approved 9/15/2005 be extended for one
year.

CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTACHED

RECEIVED14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Kaylene R. Gardner Title Regulatory Assistant SEP2 8 2006
Signature Date 08/24/2006 DIVOF0lLGAS&MINING

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby_
' PGÍfOl_ 1 Engineer Date 1 2OQg

Conditionsof approval,if any, are attached. Approvalof thisnoticedoesnot warrant or
certifythatthe applicantholdslegalor equitabletitleto thoserightsin the subjectlease Office
which would entitle the applicantto conductoperationsthereon.
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crime forany personknowinglyand willfully tomaketo any departmentor agencyof the United
Statesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations asto anymatter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructionson page



CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

EOG Resources, LLC

Notice of Intent
APD Extension

Lease: UTU-01304
Well: E. Chapita 5-5
Location: NENE Sec 5-T9S-R23E

An extension for the referenced APD is approved with the following conditions:

1. The extension and APD shall expire on 9/15/07

2. No other extension shall be granted.

If you have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Matt Baker of this office at
(435)



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: EOG RESOURCES INC

Well Name: E CHAPITA 5-5

Api No: 43-047-36490 Lease Type: FEDERAL

Section 05 Township 09S Range 23E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor ROCKER DRILLING RIG # 1

SPUDDED:
Date 10/16/06

Time 4:00 PM

How DRY

Drilling wi/I Commence:

Reported by JAY

Telephone # (435) 828-1720

Date 10/18/06 Signed



STATE OF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTIONFORM

Operator. EOG Resources, Inc. Operator Account Number: N 9550

Address: 600 17th St., Suite 1000N

city Denver

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (303) 824-5526

Well i
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-36830 Chapita Wells Unit 676-6 SESW 6 9S 23E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

A

Num r Number

10/16/2006

|E a

Comments: ..

Well 2
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

43-047-36490 East Chapita 5-5 NENE 5 9S 23E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EffectiveDate

A 99999
" 10/16/2006 /Û / )

Comments:

Well 3
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-013-33094 Pete's Wash 10-36 NENE 36 10S 16E Duchesne

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EffectiveDate

A 99999 10/18/2006 /O /
Comments:

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish newentity for newwell (singlewell only) Mary A. Maestas

B - Add newwell to existingentity (groupor unit well) lease Print)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity sig re

E - Other (Explain In 'comments' section) RECENED Regulato ssistant 10/18/2006
Title Date

OUT1 8 2006
(6f2000)

DNOF0\L,GAS&



Fonn 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(Febnuuy2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR ÑÊÙÊlÄ007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSenalNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 3 4

Do not use thIs form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructíons on reverse sidG. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No

1. Typeot II
OilWell GasWell Other 8. WellNameandNo.

East Chapita 5-52. NameofOperator EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API Well No.
3a Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 43-047-36490

600 17th Street, Suite l000N, Denver, CO 80202 303-824-5526 10.Fieldand Pool,or Exploratory Area
4 Location of Well (Footage,Sec, T, R.,M, or SurvevDescnption) Natural Buttes/Wasatch/Mesaverde

601' FNL & 631' FEL (NENE) 11. Countyor Parish, State

Sec. 5-T9S-R23E 40.070342 LAT 109.343772 LON Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) WaterShut-Off
Noticeof Intent AlterCasing FractureTreat Reclamation WellInte¢ty

SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other
ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporarilyAbandon

FinalAbandonment Notice Convertto Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13 DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearly state all pertinentdetails,including estimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If theproposalistodeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurface locationsand measured and truevettical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.
Attach theBond under which thework will be performedor providethe Bond No. on filewith BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must befiledwithin 30 days
followingcompletion oftheinvolvedoperations. If theoperationresults ina multiplecompletionor recompletionina new interval,a Form31604 must befiledonce
testinghasbeencompleted. FinalAbandonmentNoticesmustbe filedonly afterallrequirements,includingreclamation, havebeencompleted, andtheoperator has
determinedthatthesiteisready forfinalinspection.)

EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization for disposal of produced water from the referenced well to any of the following locations.

l. Natural Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD
2. Ace Disposal
3. RN Industries

Accepted by theUtah Division ofL Gas and Mining
CORDONLY

14. I hereby certify thatthe foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Mary A. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant

Date

THIS SPACE'FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved y Title Date
Conditionsof approval, ifany, are attached. Approval of thisnotice doesnot warrant or
certify thattheapplicant holdslegalor equitabletitleto thoserights in thesubject lease Office
which would entitle theapplicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crimeforanyperson knowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agencyofthe United
States any false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to anymatter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page 2)

RECEIVED
OCT3 0 2006

DIVOF DII CAR A



Fonn 31(&5 UNITEDSTATES FORMAPPROVED
(February2005) DEPARTMENTOFTHEINTERIOR E

esN 13

BUREAUOFLAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSenalNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-Ol304

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse sidG. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Typeo Il
OilWell / GasWell Other 8. WellName and No.

2. NameofOperator East Chapita 5-5
EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36490

600 17th Street, Suite 1000N, Denver, CO 80202 303-824-5526 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage, Sec.,T, R, M, or SurveyDescription) Natural Buttes/wasatch/Mesaverde

601' FNL & 631' FEL (NENE) 11. CountyorParish, State

Sec. 5-T9S-R23E 40.070342 LAT 109.343772 LON Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NGIICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Acidi2e Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off
Noticeof Intent Alter Casing FractureTreat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other Well spud

ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporarilyAbandon
Final AbandonmentNotice Convertto Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposedor CompletedOperation (clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof
If theproposal istodeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurface locations and measured and truevertical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.
AttachtheBond underwhich thework will beperformedor providetheBondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must befiledwithin 30days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. If theoperation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval,a Form31604 must be filedonce
testinghasbeencompleted. FinalAbandonmentNotices must be filed only after all requirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted, and theoperator has
determinedthatthesite isready forfinalinspection.)

The referenced well spud on 10/16/06.

14. I hereby certify thatthe foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Maestas Title Reg atory Assistant

THIS SPA E FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved_g_________
_________

Title Date

Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approval of thisnotice doesnot warrant or
certify thatthe applicant holdslegalor equitable titleto thoserights inthe subjectlease Office
which would entitlethe applicant to conductoperationsthereon.
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crime for anypersonknowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations asto anymatterwithin itsjurisdiction.
(Instructions on page 2) HECEIVED

OCT3 0 2006

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Iimn 3160-5 UNITED STATES H)RM APPROVED
(February2(X)5) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR I rÛ$IiŠl 007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeasesenalNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U "'3"*

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,Allottee or TribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse sidG. 7. If Unitor CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1. Type of 11
OilWell GasWell Other 8. Well Name and Na

2. Name of Operator East chapita5-05
EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area c<xle) 43-047-36490
600 17th Street. Suite 1000N, Denver. CO 80202 303-824-5526 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4. Location of Well (Footage,Sec, T.,R., M, or Siuver Description) Natural Buttes/Wasatch/Mesaverde

601' FNL & 631' FEL (NENE) I I. CountyorParish, State
Sec. 5-T9S-R23E 40.070342 LAT 109.343772 LON Uintah County. Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NGTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Produenon (Sm Resume) Water Shut-Off
Noticeof Intent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Wellntegnty

O SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other Commingling

O ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporanlyAbandon application
O FinalAbandonment Notice Convertto Injection Plug Back WaterDisposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearly state all pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof.
If the proposalis to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locationsand measured and truevertical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will beperformed or provide the Bond No. on filewith BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30days
followingcompletion of theinvolved operations. If the operation results ina multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 31604 must be filed once
testing hasbeencompleted. Final Abandonment Notices must befiledonly after all æquirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted, and theoperator has
detennined that the site is ready forfinalinspection.)

EOG Resources. Inc. requests authorization for commingling of production from the Wasatch and Mesaverde formations in the referenced
wellbore. In the event allocation of production is necessary, the allocation will be based on proportionate net pay as calculated kom open hole
logs. Production kom the Wasatch and Mesaverde formations will be commingled in the wellbore and produced through open ended 2-3/8"
tubing landed below all perforations in the 4-1/2" production casing.

Attached is a map showing the location of all wells on contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units and an affidavit showing that this application
has been provided to owners of all contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the pool.

RECElVED
JUNO62007

Div.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Tvped)

Mary A. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant

Si Date 06/05/2007

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approvedby Title gy N Date
Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approval of thisnotice doesnot warrant or ISion FederalMYcertify that the applicant holds legalor equitable title to those rights in thesubject lease Office \pl A \SpgeSSSO
which would entitle theapplicant to conduct operations thereon. and Acton
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crime forany person knowm or agency of the United
States any false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its juns
(Instructions on page



STATEOFCOLORADO)

) ss

COUNTYOFDENVER)

VERIFICATION

Mary A. Maestas, of lawful age, being first duly sworn upon oath, deposes and
says:
She is the Regulatory Assistant of EOG Resources, Inc., of Denver, Colorado. EOG
Resources, Inc. is the operator of the following described well:

EAST CHAPITA 5-05
601' FNL - 631' FEL (NENE)

SECTION 5, T9S, R23E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

EOG Resources, Inc.is the only owner in the well and/or of all contiguous
oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the pool.

On the 5thday of June, 2007 she placed in the United States mail, with postage
prepaid, a copy of the attached Application for Commingling in one wellbore for the
subject well.

Said envelope, which contained these instruments, was addressed to the Utah
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining, and the Bureau of Land Management.

Further affiant saith not.

Mary A. aestas
Regul ry Assistant

Subscribed and sworn before me this 5thday of June, 2007.

otary Ñblic
My Commission
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Form 31f65 UNITEDSTATES FORMAPPROVED
(February2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR ŠÌ¡ oo;

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U 13"*

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,Allottee or TribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposais.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement, Nameand/or No.

1. Type o 11
OilWell / GasWell Other 8. WellNameand Na

East Chapita 5-05
2. NameotOperator EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36490

600 17th Street, Suite 1000N, Denver, CO 80202 303-824-5526 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4. Location of Well (Footage,Sec. T. R , M., or SutvevDescnption) Natural Buttes/Mesaverde

601' FNL & 631' FEL (NENE)
I l. CountyorParish, State

Sec. 5-T98-R23E 40.070342 LAT 109.343772LON Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NØTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Production (Surt/Resume) Water Shut-Off

O Noticeof Intent Alter Casing FractureTreat Reclamation WeßIntgty

SubsequentReport Casing Repaa NewConstruction Recomplete Other

ChangePlans Plugand Abandon TemporanlyAbandon

OFinal AbandonmentNotice ConvertmInjection PlugBack WaterDisposal

13. Describe Proposed or CompletedOperation(clearly state all pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting dateof any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depthsof all pertinent markets and zones.

Attach theBondunder which the work will beperformed or providethe BondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequent reports must be filedwithin 30days

following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form31644 must be tiledonce

testing has beencompleted. FinalAbandonment Noticesmust befiledonly after all requirements, includingreclamation, havebeen completed, and the operator has

determinedthatthe site isready forfinalinspection.)

The referenced well was turned to sales on 6/4/20(r1. Please see the attached operations summary report for drilling and completion operations

performed on the subject well.

14. Ihereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

laest Title Regulatory AssistantWOS/20&7

THIS SPACAFOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved Title Date

Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approvalof thisnotice doesnot warrant or

certify thatthe applicant holdslegalor equitable titleto thoserights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operationsthereon.

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department e United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction REC
(Instructions on page 2)

JUR1 1 2007

DN.0F016GAS&



WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 06-08-2007

Well Name ECW 0054)5 Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA DEEP API # 43-047-36490 Well Class 1SA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 04-06-2007 Class Date 06-04-2007

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 9,535/ 9,535 Property # 056062

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 4,962/ 4,942

Location Section 5. T9S, R23E, NENE,601 FNL & 631 FEL

Event No LO Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES,INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 84.75

AFE No 303269 AFE Total 2,028,800 DHC / CWC 887,100/ 1,141,700

Rig Contr BASIC Rig Name BASIC #32 Start Date 03-13-2007 Release Date

Rig Contr BASIC Rig Name BASIC #32 Start Date 04-13-2005 Release Date 04-23-2007

Rig Contr BASIC Rig Name BASIC#32 Start Date 04-13-2007 Release Date

04-13-2005 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

601' FNL & 631' FEL (NE/NE) LOT l

SECTION 5. T9S, R23E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

LAT 40.070342, LONG 109.343772 (NAD 83)

LAT 40.070378, LONG 109.343092 (NAD 27)

BASICRIG #32

TD: 9535' WASATCH

DW/GAS

EAST CHAPITA PROSPECT

DD&A: CHAPITA DEEP

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD

LEASE: U-01304

ELEVATION:4943.3' NAT GL, 4942.4' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING4942' IS THE PREP GL), 4962' KB



Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

EOG WI 100%, NRI 84.75%

10-12-2006 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $25,475 Completion $0 Daily Total $25,475

Cum Costs: Drilling $25,475 Completion $0 Well Total $25,475

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 STARTED ACCESSROAD TO LOCATION.

10-13-2006 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $1,260 Completion 50 Daily Total $1,260

Cum Costs: Drilling $26,735 Completion 50 Well Total 526,735

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 ACCESS ROAD COMPLETE. STARTINGLOCATION.

10-16-2006 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $1.260 Completion $0 Daily Total $1,260

Cum Costs: Drilling $27,995 Completion $0 Well Total $27,995

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LINING PIT.

10-17-2006 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $1,260 Completion $0 Daily Total $1,260

Cum Costs: Drilling $29,255 Completion 50 Well Total $29,255

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LINING PIT.

10-18-2006 Reported By TERRY CSERE

DailyCosts: Drilling $1,260 Completion 50 Daily Total $1,260
Cum Costs: Drilling 530,515 Completion $0 Well Total $30,515

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days O MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Ficid: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

06:00 06:00 24.0 TOO MUDDY TO FINAL BLADE.

10-19-2006 Reported By JERRY BARNES

DailyCosts: Drilling $2,310 Completion $0 Daily Total $2,310

Cum Costs: Drilling $32,825 Completion $0 Well Total 532,825

MD 40 TVD 40 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO AIR RIG /BUILD LOCATION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION COMPLETE.ROCKY MOUNTAIN DRILLINGSPUD AN 18" HOLE ON 10/16/2006 @ 4:00 PM, SET 60'

OF 14" CONDUCTOR, CEMENT TO SURFACE WITH READY MIX. JERRY BARNES NOTIFIED MICHAEL LEE

WIBLM ANDCAROL DANlELSW/UDOGMOF THE SPUD 10/16/2006 @ 2:45 PM.

10-27-2006 Reported By JOHN HELCO

DailyCosts: Drilling $226,048 Completion 50 Daily Total $226,048

Cum Costs: Drilling $258,873 Completion $0 Well Total $258,873

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU BILL JR'S AIR RIG #5 ON 10/22/2006. DRILLED 12 1/4" HOLE TO 2550' GL. ENCOUNTERED WATER @

2080'. RAN 59 JTS (2517.60') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#/FT.1--55, ST&C CASING WITH WEATHERFORD GUIDE SHOE AND

FLOAT COLLAR. 8 CENTRALIZERS SPACED MIDDLE OF SHOEJOINT AND EVERY COLLAR TILL GONE.

LANDED @ 2537' KB. RDMO BILL JR'S AIR RIG.

RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINES AND CEMENT VALVE TO 1000

PSIG. PUMPED 180 BBLS FRESHWATER & 20 BBLSGELLED WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT. MlXED &
PUMPED200 SX (41 BBLS) OF PREMIUMCEMENTW/2% CaCl2 & ¼ #lSX FLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8

PPGW/YlELD OF 1.15 CFS. DISPLACEDCEMENT W/192 BBLS FRESH WATER. BUMPED PLUGWl650# @4:17

PM, 10/25/2006. CHECKED FLOAT,FLOATHELD. SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. NO RETURNS.

TOP JOB #1: MIXED & PUMPED 125 SX (27 BBLS) OF PREMIUM CEMENT Wl2% CaCl2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE.

MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPGWlYIELD OF l.15 CF/SX. NO RETURNS.WOC 2 HR.

TOP JOB #2: MIXED & PUMPED 125 SX (26 BBLS) OF PREMIUMCEMENT W/2% CaCl2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE.

MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. NO RETURNS.

TOP JOB #3: MIXED & PUMPED225 SX (46 BBLS)OF PREMIUMCEMENTW/2% CaCl2 & ¼ #/SX FLOCELE.

MIXEDCEMENT @ 15.8 PPGW/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. HOLE FILLED AND STOOD FULL. RD BIG 4

CEMENTERS.

PREPAREDLOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORTUNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

MIRU SLICK LINE UNIT & SURVEY TOOL. RAN IN HOLE & TAGGED @ 2398', PICK UP TO 2390'. TOOK

SURVEY. 1 DEGREE.

JOHN HELCONGTIFIED DONNA KINNEY W/VBLM OFTHE SURFACE CASING & CEMENT JOB ON 10/24/2006

@ 12:01 PM.

03-13-2007 Reported By KENNY WICK
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

DailyCosts: Drilling $16,695 Completion $0 Daily Total $16,695

Cum Costs: Drilling 5261,708 Completion 50 Well Total $261,708

MD 2.570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MI BASICRIG 32 W/WEST ROC TRUCKING. 80% RIG DELIVERED. SUB BASE & DRAWWORKS,DP IN AM.

NO INCIDENTS/ACClDENTS

SAFTEY MEETINGW/WEST ROC DRIVERS.

NO RIG REPAIRS.S

03-14-2007 Reported By KENNY WICK

DailyCosts: Drilling $16,695 Completion $0 Daily Total $16,695

Cum Costs: Drilling $264,543 Completion 50 Well Total $264,543

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU BASIC #32. MOB IN COLLARS, DP, SUB BASE & DRAWWORKS.SPOT MUD TANKS,FLOAT & RIG.

03-15-2007 Reported By KENNY WICK

DailyCosts: Drilling $16,879 Completion $0 Daily Total $16,879

Cum Costs: Drilling $267,562 Completion $0 WeH Total $267,562

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 18:00 12.0 MIRU BASIC#32. RIG UP MUD TANKS,SPGI' GAS BUSTER & GET FABRICATION SPECSFOR DISCHARGE 6'

DROP & DRAIN TO SHAKER POSSUM BELLY. MATERIAL IN AM. SPOT TRIP TANK. LAY LINER DOWN
BETWEEN MUD TANKSAND RESERVE PIT. MIRU MUD LOGGERS HOUSE. RIG TRAVELING BLOCKS
DELIVERED, WRONG SIZE SHEEVES (1 1/8) RIG IS 1 1/4. NEW BLOCKS SCHEDULED FOR FRIDAY AM. RU
PASON UNITS & SOUND AND CELL INTERNET & COMMUNICATIONS.

WELD ON MUD BOAT, RAMPS & GUIDES. WELD ON CENTRIFUGE DISCHARGE LINE. SET CHOKE
MANIFOLD IN BUTTOM OF GAS BUSTER SKID, INSPECT & PREPARE BOPE FOR NIPPLE UP.

FMC DELIVERED DSA WELLHEAD ADAFTER, 10 INCHES TO LONG FOR NIPPLE UP UNDER BEAMS. WILL
DELIVER CORRECT ADAFTER FRIDAYAM.

NOACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS

FULL CREWS

SAFTEY MEETING: EMPHASISON PERSONAL PRUTECTIVE GEAR FOR ALL PERSONNEL ON LOCATION AT
ALL TIMES

18:00 06:00 12.0 SDFN.

03-16-2007 Reported By KENNYWICK
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

DailyCosts: Drilling 587,544 Completion $0 Daily Total $87,544

Cum Costs: Drilling $341,246 Completion 50 Well Total $341,246

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURTBASIC32

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 RURT RU BASIC32, FABRICATE AND WELD ON GAS BUSTER. FABRICATE AND WELD PASON MOUNTS ON
CROWN SECTION. WELD ON DERRICK BOARD. WORK ON RIG CONTROL PANEL. INSTALL CROWN-A-

MATICON DRAWWORKS.WORK AND INSTALL DRAWWORKS BRAKEASSIST. WORK ON & INSTALL
AUTOMATIC SAFTEY SHUT-DOWNS ON RIG PUMPS. FABRICATE & WELD PROTECTIVE SHIELDS OVER
PUMP MOTOR TURBOCHARGERS. TACK WELD GUIDES IN MUD BOAT. SPOT HOPPER HOUSE. WAIT ON
SEALS FOR HOPPER HOUSE MUD LINES. RIG UP GUN LINES. RIG PASON UNITS. RIG UP COMMUNICATION
INTERCOMS. OFF-LOAD KELLY/SAVER SUBS. PIPE RACKS.

RIG @ 30% RIG UP.

OFF LOAD JARS, MUD MOTORS, ROLLER REAMERS,RUTATING HEADASSEMBLY & ELEMENTS.

2 X 506Z JETTED (TFA 1.18) BITS ON LOCATION. RESERVE PIT WATER CHECKED BY MUD ENGINEER.

18:00 06:00 12.0 SDFN.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

SAFTEY MEETING: FORKLIFT OPS DURING RIG UP. PPE. SAFTEY TIE-OFF WHILE WORKING OVERHEAD.
SAFTEY OBSERVATION & AWARENESS OF OTHER CREWS/SERVICE PERSONNEL.

FULL CREWS.

60 °, CLEAR.

03-17-2007 Reported By KENNY WICK

DailyCosts: Drilling $25,221 Completion $0 Daily Total $25,221

Cum Costs: Drilling 5352,607 Completion 50 WeH Total $352,607

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT BASIC 32

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 RURT. RU BASIC 32. FABRICATE & WELD ON PUMP GUARDS. FABRICATE & WELD PASON BRACKETS FOR
PUMPS. FABRICATE & WELD GUARD FOR TURBOCHARGER ON PUMP ENGINE.

CONTINUE FABRICATE & WELD GAS BUSTER LINES WlDRAINSTO SHAKER POSSUM BELLY. CONTINUE
INSTALL AIR & ELECTRICLINES IN PUMP HOUSES FOR REMOTE EMERGENCY SHUT-DOWN CONTROLS.
RE-PLUMP AIR LINES FOR NEW CROWN-O-MATIC & FABRICATE & INSTALL REMUTE CROWN-O-MATIC
RE-SET ON DRILLERSPANEL. FABRICATE & WELD HI-PRESSURE MUD LINES & HOLDINGBRACKETSIN
SUB-BASE FOR STAND PIPE ACCESS. WELD & FABRICATE ROD WASHERS ON MUD PUMPS.

RIG @ 40% RIG UP.

OF-LOAD THIRY JTS TRI-SPIRAL HWDP FROM QUAIL TOOLS. OFF-LOAD OIL BUNKERS. OFF-LAOD FMC
WELLHEAD DRILLING SPOOL ASSEMBLY. (INSTALL IN AM & NIPPLE UP). INSTALL ZECO HAND RAILS ON
GAS BUSTER. RU PASON WORKSTATIONS.

18:00 06:00 12.0 SDFN.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.

SAFTEY MEETING. WORKINGW/ WELDERS. PROPER CLOTHING & PPE.
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

FULL CREWS.

65 ', CLEAR.

03-18-2007 Reported By KENNY WICK

DailyCosts: Drilling $14,210 Completion 50 Daily Total $14.210

Cum Costs: Drilling 5366,818 Completion $0 Well Total 5366,818

MD 2,570 TVD 2.570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURT. RU BASIC32.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 18:00 12.0 RURT BASIC 32. INSTALLFMC DRILLING CONNECTOR, TORQUE LOCK DOWN BOLTS TO SPECS @ 300

FT/LBS. PRESSURE TEST SEALS TO 5000 PSI / 5 MIN. NIPPLE UP BASICDRLG MUD CROSS KILUCHOKE
VALVE ASSEMBY. DOUBLE RAMSTO HEAVY FOR EXTEND-A-BOOM FORKLIFT TO PICK UP AND SPUT
FOR SAFE NIPPLE-UP. ARRANGE FOR FORKLlFT IN AM FROM BASIC 30. WO DERRICK TRAVELING
BLOCKS. FABRICATE & WELD BUFFERTANK FOR CHOKE MANIFOLD. FABRICATE & WELD SNUBBING
POST ON RIG FLOOR. RIG UP 6" HOSES FOR DRAINS ON GAS BUSTER LINESTO SHAKER. RUN
ELECTRICAL LINES ALONG MUD TANKS. RIG UP YELLOW DOG. CHANGE DISHARGE FROM 2" TO 3".

RIG @ 50% RIG UP.

OFF-LOAD TWO 400 BBL UPRIGHT TANKS. POLICE UP LOCATION AND SURROUNDING AREA.

18:00 06:00 12.0 SDFN.

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS.
FULL CREWS.

SAFTEY TOPICS. HOUSEKEEPING, TRAVELINGTO AND FROM WORK, PPE, NIPPLE UP OPS.
70° CLEAR.

03--19-2007 Reported By KENNY WICK

DailyCosts: Drilling $23,814 Completion $0 Daily Total $23,814

Cum Costs: Drilling $376,772 Completion $0 Well Total $376,772

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RURT BASIC 32.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 18:00 12.0 RURT BASIC 32. FABRICATE & WELD ON CHOKE MANIFOLD BUFFER TANK. BLOCKS DELIVERED 0900

HRS. BLOCKSPLACED IN DERRICK TO STRING LINES. TOOLPUSHER NGI'ED TIGHT FIT OF DRLGLINE IN
SHEAVES, WENT TO TOWN TO CONSULT WITH BASICDRLG SUPERINDENDENT DECIDED BLOCK
SHEAVES WERE IN SPECS. STRING UP DRLG LINE IN MAST. BACK RIG INTO PLACEON MUD BOAT.
PREPARE RIG TO RAISE DERRICK. WILL RAISE DERRICK IN AM.

RIG @60% RIG UP.

POLICE LOCATION & SURROUNDING AREA. INSTALL GROUND RODSON CAMP UNITSAND WATER TANK.

18:00 06:00 12.0 BASIC CREWS SDFN. WELDERS CONTINUE FABRICATE & WELD ON CHOKE MANIFOLD BUFER TANK AND
BUSTER LINES TO 2130 HRS.

FULL CREWS.

NOACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

SAFTEY MEETING TOPICS: POTENTlAL WELDER FLASH BURNS, OVERHEAD TIE-OFFS, HOISTINGHEAVY

EQUIPMENT, PINCH POINTS.
65°, CLEAR.

03-20-2007 Reported By KENNYWICK

DailyCosts: Drilling $22,298 Completion $0 Daily Total $22,298

Cum Costs: Drilling $385,210 Completion 50 Well Total $385,210

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RURTBASIC 32

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 19:00 13.0 RURT BASIC 32. PREPARE RIG TO RAISE DERRICK, BLEED AIR FROM HYDRAULICSYSTEM. BURN IN

BRAKE ASSIST UNIT. RAISE DERRICK. WAIT ON SLIPS FOR DRAWWORKS DRILL LINE CLAMP. (DOG
KNOT). TRAlN DRILLERS IN BLEEDINGHYDRAULICS AND RAISING DERRICK. SET IN AND SPUT RIG
PUMPS & BOILER. FABRICATE & WELD RIG TONG SNUB LINE POSTS. FINISH WELD ON BUFFER TANK &

FLARE LINE CONNECTIONS.RIG UP PASON MUD TANK UNITS. WELD BRACKETSIN ACCUMULATOR

HOUSE & MUD TANK LIGHTS. HOOK UP ACCUMULATORLINESTO SUB BASE.PAINT HAND RAILS. HOOK

UP DERRICK ANCHOR LINES.

RIG @ 70% RIG UP.

19:00 06:00 I I.0 SDFN.

FULL CREWS.

NOACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

SAFTEY MEETINGTOPICS: DERRICK RAISING OPS, FALLING OBJECTS, LINE ENTANGLEMENTS,
HORSEPLAY.
70°, CLOUDY.

03-21-2007 Reported By CARLOSARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $7,581 Completion $0 Daily Total 57,581

Cum Costs: Drilling $392,791 Completion 50 Well Total $392,791

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WAITON DAYLIGHT TO CONTINUE RIG UP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 19:00 13.0 RURT BASIC 32., BLEEDINGHYDRAULICS LINES, WAIT ON ONE GUIDE LINE (ANCHOR LINE) TO FINISH

RAISE DERRICK, FABRICATE SAFETY LINES, WELDERS WORK ON CHOKEAND GAS BUSTER LINES, FINISH

85%, RIG UP 73%

19:00 06:00 11.0 SDFN

NOACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

FULLCREW

SAFETY MEETINGTOPICS: GENERAL RIG UP

03-22-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRŒTA

Daily Costs: Drilling $22,097 Completion $0 Daily Total $22,097

Cum Costs: Drilling $414,888 Completion 50 Well Total $414,888
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Well Name: ECW (X)5-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIGGING UP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 19:00 13.0 RURT BASIC 32, SET RIG EQUIPMENT ON RIG FLOOR. RIG UP FLOOR 20%, CHECK ON PUMP MOTORS&
DWRKS MOTORS, OK, WORK ON FLOW LINE BETWEEN SHAKERS, INSTALL NEW ANCHOR LINEON
DERRICK, WORK ON TRAVELING BLOCK ONE SHEAVE IS LOCKED, WAIT ON MECHANIC, WELDERS
WORK ON CHOKE AND GAS BUSTER LINES. FINISH 92%, STAIRSTO GAS BUSTER FINISH & MOUNTED,
RIG UP 78%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

FULL CREW

SAFETY MEETINGTOPICS: SLIP & FALL, PINCH POINT'S

03-23-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $9,379 Completion $0 Daily Total $9,379

Cum Costs: Drilling $424,267 Completion 50 Well Total $424,267

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIG UP, WAIT ON TRAVELINGBLOCK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 19:00 12.0 RURT BASIC 32, RIG DOWN TRAVELINGBLOCK & SEND TO VERNAL TO REPAIR, NEED TO CHANGE SEAL
IN ONE OF THE SHEAVES, WELDERS COMPLETED CHOKE AND GAS BUSTER LINES, GENERAL RIG UP,
RIG UP 80%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS
FULL CREW

SAFETY MEETING TOPICS:WORK ON TRAVELING BLOCK

03-24-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $4,998 Completion $0 Daily Total $4,998

Cum Costs: Drilling 5429,265 Completion $0 Well Total $429,265

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIGGING UP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

07:00 19:00 12.0 RURT BASIC 32, CREW WORKING ON POP OFF LINESON PUMPS. FINISH RIGGINGUP CHOKE AND FLARE

LINES,TRAVELING BLOCKARRIVED ON LOCATION @ 14:30 PM, CREW WORKINGON RIGGING UP BLOCK,

3 WELDERSON LOCATIONWORKlNG FOR BASICON RIGGINGUP, RIG UP 80%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS

FULL CREW

SAFETYMEETINGTOPICS: WORK ON CHOKE LINES

03-25-2007 Reported By CARLOSARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $6,315 Completion 50 Daily Total $6,315

Cum Costs: Drilling $435,580 Completion 50 Well Total 5435,580

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIGING UP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 19:00 12.0 RURT BASIC32, GENERAL RIGGING UP,RAISE DERRICK, NIPPLE UP BOP'S, SET PRE-MIX TANK & RIG UP

SAME, SET 2 - 400 BBLS TANK. & FILL WITH WATER, FILL S. SHAKE TANK WITH WATER, WELDER WORK

ON SUCTION TANK VALVES, 4 WELDERSON LOCATION RIG UP, 08:00 PM PICK UP & LAY DOWN ROTARY

TABLE& SEND TO BASIC31, RIG UP 85%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS

(9) MEN + (1)TOOL PUSHER ON LOCATION

SAFETY MEETING TOPICS: RAISE DERRICK

03-26-2007 Reported By CARLOSARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $4,186 Completion 50 Daily Total $4,186

Cum Costs: Drilling $439,766 Completion $0 Well Total 5439,766

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days O MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIGGING UP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 19:00 12.0 RURT BASIC 32, GENERAL RIGGING UP - CREW WORKINGON FLOW LINE - TRY TO OPEN BOP DOORSTO

CHANGE RAMS, PROBLEM WITH ACCUMULATOR, DOORSWOULD NOT OPEN, MECHANICWILL BE ON

THE RIG INTHE MORNING - RUTARY TABLE ARRIVEDON LOCATION05:00 PM, OLD TABLE DIFFERENT

SET UP, SEND BACKTO VERNAL, NEW ROTARY TABLE FROMVERNALARRIVED @ 08:00 PM - I WELDER

WORKINGON RIG UP, RIG UP 87%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS

(8) MEN + (1)TOOL PUSHER ON LOCATION

SAFETY MEETlNG TOPICS: USEFACEPRŒECTOR WHEN GRINDING
03-27-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $8,509 Completion 50 Daily Total 58,509
Cum Costs: Drilling $448,275 Completion $0 Well Total $448,275

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIGGING UP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 19:00 12.0 RURTBASIC 32, GENERAL RIGGING UP - CREW & WELDERWORKON FLOW LINE - WAIT FOR MECHANIC

TO WORK ON BOPACCUMULATOR - WAIT ON CONNECT FLANGE TO RIG UP RŒARY TABLE - WELDER
FlNISH WITH SUCTION TANK VALVES - 3 WELDERS IN LOCATION WORKING ON RIG UP - RIG UP 89%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

(7) MEN + (1)TOOL PUSHER ON LOCATION

SAFETY MEETING TOPICS: WORK ON FLOW LINE

03-28-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling 54,823 Completion $0 Daily Total $4,823
Cum Costs: Drilling $453,098 Completion 50 Well Total $453,098

MD 2.570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RIG UP, WAIT ON PARTS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 19:00 12.0 RURT BASIC 32, SLOW RIGGINGUP - WELDER WORK ON FLOW LINE - WAITFOR MECHANIC TO WORK

ON BOP ACCUMULATOR - WAIT ON CONNECT HUB TO RIG UP ROTARY TABLE - 2 WELDERS IN LOCATION
RIGGING UP - RIG UP 90%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

(1) DRILLER (3) MEN + (1)TOOL PUSHER ON LOCATION

SAFETY MEETING TOPICS: GENERAL RIG UP

03-29-2007 Reported By CARLOSARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $15,288 Completion $0 Daily Total $15,288
Cum Costs: Drilling $468,386 Completion $0 Well Total $468,386

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RIG UP,WAIT ON PARTS

Page



Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 19:00 12.0 RURT BASIC 32, RIGGING UP - WELDER FINISH WORK ON FLOW LINE - WAIT FOR MECHANIC TO WORK

ON BOP ACCUMULATOR - WAITING ON CONNECT HUB TO RIG UP ROTARY TABLE - 2 WELDERS IN
LOCATION RIGGING UP - RIG UP 91%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

FUEL 7,333 GLS.

FULL CREW - (1) TOOL PUSHER ON LOCATION

SAFETY MEETING TOPICS: USED FACE PROTECTOR

03-30-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $5,687 Completion 50 Daily Total 55,687

Cum Costs: Drilling $474,073 Completion $0 Well Total $474,073

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIGGING UP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 19:00 12.0 RURT BASIC 32 - WAITFOR MECHANICTO WORK ON BOP ACCUMULATOR - CONNECT HUB FOR ROTARY

TABLE ARRIVED ON LOCATION @ 16:30 PM, SET ROTARY TABLE IN PLACE- RIG UP POWER TONG &

FUNCTION TEST - WELDERS BUILD & INSTAL NEW WATER LINE FOR BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM - FINISH
BUILD MOUSE HOLE PIPE - (2) WELDERS IN LOCATION RIGGINGUP - RIG UP 93%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NOACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS

FUEL 6,333 GLS.

FULL CREW - (1) TOOL PUSHER ON LOCATION

SAFETY MEETINGTOPICS: PICK UP RUTARY TABLE

03-31-2007 Reported By CARLOSARRIETA

Daily Costs: Drilling $5,272 Completion $0 Daily Total $5.272

Cum Costs: Drilling 5479,345 Completion $0 Well Total $479,345

MD 2,570 TVD 2.570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIGGING UP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 19:00 12.0 RURT BASIC 32, SLOW RIGGINGUP - MECHANIC ARRIVE ON LOCATION 06:30 PM TO WORK ON BOP
ACCUMULATOR, FUNCTION TEST BOP', OK - FINISH BUILD KELLY SOCK & SET ON FLOOR - FILL MUD

TANKS & FUNCTION TEST ALL CENTRIFUGAL PUMPS - BASIC& SMITH MECANICWORKINGON FLOOR

MUTORS- (1) WELDERS IN LOCATION RIGGINGUP - RIG UP 94%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS

FUEL 7083 GLS.
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

(8) MEN - (1) TOOL PUSHER ON LOCATION

SAFETY MEETlNGTOPICS: PINCH POINS

04-01-2007 Reported By CARLOSARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $3,644 Completion 50 Daily Total 53,644

Cum Costs: Drilling 5482,989 Completion 50 Well Total $482,989

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIGGINGUP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 19:00 12.0 RIG UP - CHANGED BOP RAMS - BUILD HANGINGLINES FOR TONGS - LOAD BHA ON RACK - REPLACE #

2 WINCH LINE - WELDER BUILD BRACKET FOR AUTODRILLER - MECHANIC FROM BASIC & SMITH
WORKING ON #2 MOTOR TRANSMISSION BUILDINGA NEW WIRE HARNESS, THIS MAY TAKE 2-3 DAYS-

(2) WELDERS ON LOCATION WORKING ON RIG UP - RIG UP 95%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

FUEL 7083 GLS.

FULL CREW - (1) TOOL PUSHER ON LOCATION

SAFETY MEETINGTOPICS: 100% TIE OFF

04-02-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $3,644 Completion $0 Daily Total $3,644

Cum Costs: Drilling 5486,633 Completion $0 Well Total $486,633

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIGGINGUP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 19:00 12.0 WORKINGON RIG UP FLOOR - BUILD GERONIMOLINE - RIG UP KELLY & SWIVEL -NEED SNUB LINES

FOR TONGS - SOME OF THE HANDS WORK 10 HRS. - RIG UP97%

19:00 07:00 12.0 SDFN

NOACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS
FUEL 6999 GLS. USED 84 GALS.
FULL CREW - (1) NIGHT TOOL PUSHER ON LOCATION

SAFETY MEETINGTOPICS: RIG UP FLOOR

04-03-2007 Reported By CARLOSARRIETA
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

DailyCosts: Drilling 521,704 Completion $0 Daily Total $21,704

Cum Costs: Drilling 5508,337 Completion $0 Well Total $508.337

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PICK UP D. PIPE @ 1792'

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 RIG UP, TIE GERONOMOLINE. TEST MUD PUMPS, MUD LINES, GAS BUSTER, ROTARY HEAD

12:00 19:00 7.0 ****STARTDAYWORK AT 12:00 ON 4-2-07****

TEST BOP'S & VALVES: LOWER KELLY, UPPER KELLY, SAFETY VALVE, INSIDE BOP Wl250/5000 PSI F/10

MIN.,PIPE & BLIND RAMS 250/5000 PSI F/10 MIN. HYDRILL ANNULAR250/2500 PSI F/ 10 MIN., KILL LINE &

HCR 250/5000 PSI F/10 MIN., CHOKE MANIFOLD 250/5000 PSI F/MIN., SURFACECSG 1500 PSI F/ 30 MIN.

19:00 19:30 0.5 SET WEAR BUSHING

19:30 21:00 1.5 TIGHTEN ROTARYHEAD STUDS

21:00 22:00 1.0 RIG UP LAYDOWNMACHINE & SAFETY MEETING

22:00 06:00 8.0 PU/BHA & NEW 4.5" D. PIPE @ 1792', TEACHING THE HANDSTO OPERATE POWERTONGS, BREAK NEW

THREAD IN D. PIPE (MAKE UP2 TIMES)

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

FUEL 6583 GLS. USED 416 GALS.

FULL CREW - (2) TOOL PUSHERS ON LOCATION

SAFETY MEETINGTOPICS: POWER TONGS

04-04-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: DrHling $30,054 Completion $0 DaHy Total $30,054

Cum Costs: Drilling $538,391 Completion 50 WeH Total $538,391

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WAIT ON PARTSF/ # 2 MOTOR

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 PUIDRILL PIPE, BREAK-IN NEW THREADS, TEACHINGCREW TO RUN POWER TONGS

09:30 10:00 0.5 RIGGINGDOWN LAY DOWN TRUCK

10:00 11:00 1.0 TEST MUD PUMPSWITH 100 SPM, 600 PSI, 360 GPM. REPLACECAP GASKETSON # 1 & 2 MUD PUMPS.

I 1:00 06:00 19.0 DOWN FOR RIG REPAIR / WAITINGON PARTSTO REPAIR #2 MOTOR & TRANSMISSION,STRAP D. PIPE,

BUILDINGTIE-DOWN Fl BOP LINES,TOTCOEQUIPMENTON LOCAflON.

NOACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

FUEL 6,333 GLS. USED 250 GALS.

FULL CREW - DAY & NIGHT TOOL PUSHER

SAFETY MEETING TOPICS: PICK UP DRILL PIPE

04-05-2007 Reported By C. ARRIETATT BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,933 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,933
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

Cum Costs: Drilling $566,324 Completion 50 Well Total $566,324

MD 2,570 TVD 2,570 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WAIT ON WIRE HARNESS FOR #2 MUTOR TRANSMISSION.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 WO WIREING HARNESS TO REPAIR #2 MOTOR TRANSMISSION. HARNESSSENT WAS FOR 23 PIN PLUG,

NEEDED A 16 PIN PLUG.CALlBRATE PASON PIT TUTALIZERSAND OTHER SENSORSON THE RIG.

NO ACCIDENTSOR INCIDENTS.

FUEL 6,166 GLS. USED 167 GALS.

1 SHORT DERRICKHAND WENT TO BASIC30 - DAY & NIGHT TOOL PUSHER.

SAFETY MEETING TOPICS: 100% TIE OFF WORKING AT ELEVATIONS/STAIRWAY SAFETY.

DEPTH: BIT 2440', TOC 2447'.

04-06-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling $24,01I Completion 50 Daily Total $24,011

Cum Costs: Drilling 5590,335 Completion 50 Well Total $590,335

MD 2,469 TVD 2,469 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf · PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING CEMENT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 13:00 7.0 CONTINUE TO WAIT ON WIRE HARNESS TO REPAIR #2 MOTOR & TRANSMISSION.

13:00 05:00 16.0 INSTALL NEW WIREING HARNESS TO REPAIR #2 MUTOR & TRANSMISSION. TEST HARNESS, RIG MUTOR &
TRANSMISSION #2 WORKINGPROPERLY. WORK ON PASON STROKE COUNTER & STD. PIPE PRESSURE.
REPAIR PASSON. CHECKED #2 MUTOR& TRANSMISSION NOT SHIFTING PROPERLY. REPLACE OILER PUMP
ON COMPOUND. REPAIR SHIFFER ON #2 MUTOR & TRANSMISSION.

05:00 06:00 1.0 TAGCMT @ EC. (2430') DRILL CMT F/2430' - TO/ 2469', WITH 0-15K WOB, 50-60 RPM ROTARY, 90 SPM, 53
RPM MUD MUTOR, MUD WT = 8.6 / 26

HELD SAFTEYMEETINGSON GOOD COMMUNICATIONS.

NOACCIDENTSTHE LAST 24 HOURS.
TWO PUSHERS DAY & NIGHT.

FULL CREWS.

FUEL ON HAND 5957 GAL.

FUEL USED 209 GAL.

CHECKED CROWN O MATIC.

04-07-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling 526,461 Completion $0 Daily Total $26,461

Cum Costs: Drilling $616,797 Completion $0 Well Total $616,797

MD 2,881 TVD 2,881 Progress 311 Days 1 MW 8.7 Visc 34.0
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLINGAHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 DRILL CMT. F/2469' - TO/ 2472', WITH 0-15K WOB, 50-60 RPM ROTARY, 90 SPM, 53 RPM MUD MOTOR, PUMP
PRESSURE 645 PSI.

06:30 09:00 2.5 REPLACEBUTTERFLY VALVEIN SUCTION PIT & MODIFYACTUATER HANDLETO OPEN & CLOSE VALVE.

09:00 10:30 1.5 DRILL CMT.& FLT EQUIPMENT, F/2472'- TO/ 2537', WITH 0-15K WOB, 50-60 RPM ROTARY, 90 SPM, 53 RPM
MUD MOTOR, PUMP PRESSURE 645 PSI.

10:30 1I:30 1.0 DRILL 33' OF ORIGINAL HOLE& 15' OF NEW HOLE F/2537' - TO/2585', 10-15K WOB, 60 RPM ROTARY, 59 RPM
MUD MŒOR. 100SPM, 730 PSI, 370 GPM.

I I:30 13:00 1.5 SPŒ 50BBL 70 VIS PILL, Wl6-SX SAWDUST @ 2585'. SHUT WELL IN PERFORM FIT Wl8.6 PPG WATER. TO
10.5-PPG MWE @ 250 PSI. PRESSURED UP TO 350 PSI HELD 250 PSI LOST 3.5 BBL.

13:00 17:30 4.5 DRILL FORMATION F/2585'- TO/2730'. 15-25K WOB, 60-80 RUTARY, 65 RPM MUD MŒOR, 110 SPM, 407
GPM, STD. PIPE 1091 PSI. DIF. 121 PSI., ROP 32 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

17:30 01:30 8.0 BLEW HYDRAULIC HOSE WHILE MAKING CONNECTION. SHIFTER ON RIG MUTORS & TRANSMISSIONS
NOT WORKING,SHUT RIG DOWN, RESTARTRIG SHIFTERSWORKING.HYDRAULICPUMPS NOT WORKING
TO MAKE CONNECTIONS. HAD TO REPLACE BOTH HYDRAULIC PUMPS.

01:30 06:00 4.5 DRILL FORMATION F/2754'- TO/2881'. 15-25K WOB, 60-80 ROTARY, 65 RPM MUD MOTOR. 110 SPM, 407
GPM, STD. PlPE 1091 PSI. DIF. 121 PSI., ROP 28 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: OPERATION OF ROGER OIL TOOL TONGS

NO ACCIDENTS THE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERSDAY & NIGHT

SHORT 1 PERSON ON BOTH EVENING& MORNING TOUR.

FUEL ON HAND5416 GAL.

FUEL USED 541 GAL.

33 DAYS NO LTA'S.

LITHOLOGY :

15% SANDSTONE

65% SHALE

20% LIMESTONE

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER

DACK GROUND GAS: 20-50 U.

CONN. GAS: 600-2200 U.

AT 2705' 2089 U GAS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7 7/8" HOLE @ 10:30 HRS, 4/6/07.

04-08-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,503 Completion $0 Daily Total $29,503

Cum Costs: Drilling $646,300 Completion $0 Well Total $646,300

MD 3,897 TVD 3,897 Progress 1,016 Days 2 MW 8.9 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLINGAHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Well Name: ECW (X)5-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL FORMATION F/2881'- TO/2913'. 15-25K WOB, 60-70 ROTARY, 65 RPM MUD MOTOR, 110 SPM, 407
GPM, STD. PIPE I 180 PSI, DIF. 121 PSI., ROP 22 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

07:30 09:00 1.5 CIRCULATE 15-MINUTES, CHECK FLOW. SURVEY @ 2913' B1T DEFTH. HAD NEAR MISS WHILE
ATTEMVilNG TO SURVEY. FOULED SLICK LINE ON DRUM. NEAR MISS REPORT FILED. NO SURVEY AT
THIS TIME CONTINUE TO DRILL TO REPAIRSLICK LINE UNIT.

09:00 10:30 1.5 DRILL FORMATIONF/2913'- TO/2976'. 15-25K WOB, 60-70 ROTARY, 65 RPM MUD MOTOR, 110 SPM, 407
GPM, STD. PIPE 1180 PSI, DIF. 121 PSI., ROP 39 FPH. (MAKE/ BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

10:30 11:30 1.0 CIRCULATE FOR 15 MINUTES.CHECK FLOW (NO FLOW). SURVEY @ 2976' B1T DEFTH, 2901' SURVEY
DEFTH. SURVEY = 1.25 DEGREES.

11:30 14:30 3.0 DRILL FORMATION F/2976' - TO/3103'. 15-25K WOB, 60-70 ROTARY, 62 RPM MUD MUTOR. 105 SPM, 388
GPM, STD. PIPE 1050 PSI, DIF. 121 PSI., ROP 42 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

14:30 15:00 0.5 SERVICE & LUBRICATE RIG. / CHECK COM

15:00 00:00 9.0 DRILL FORMATION F/3103'- TO/3511'. 15-25K WOB, 60-70 RUTARY, 62 RPM MUD MOTOR, 105 SPM, 388
GPM, STD. PIPE 1115 PSI. DIF. 132 PSI., ROP 45 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

00:00 01:00 1.0 CIRCULATE FOR 15 MINUTES. CHECK FLOW (NO FLOW). SURVEY @ 3611' BIT DEPTH, 3535' SURVEY
DEPTH. SURVEY= 2.00 DEGREES.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL FORMATION F/3611'- TO/3897'. 15-25K WOB, 60-70 RUTARY. 62 RPM MUD MOTOR, 105 SPM, 388
GPM, STD. PIPE 1161 PSI, DIF. 208 PSI., ROP 57 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK& REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGSON: SLICK LINE SURVEY

NO ACCIDENTS THE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS DAY & NlGHT.

SHORT 1 PERSON ON BUTH EVENING& MORNINGTOUR.

FUEL ON HAND 4666 GAL.

FUEL USED 750 GAL.

34 DAYS NO LTA'S.

HAD NEAR MISS FILLED A REPORT AND SENT REPORT TO ALL KEY PERSONEL.

LITHOLOGY :

35% SANDSTONE

50% SHALE

15% LIMESTONE

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER

BACK GROUND GAS: 15-25 U.

CONN. GAS: 500-3500 U.

AT 2907' /4714 U GAS

04-09-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

Daily Costs: Drilling $27,398 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,398

Cum Costs: Drilling $673,699 Completion $0 Well Total $673,699

MD 4,913 TVD 4,913 Progress 1,016 Days 3 MW 9.1 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLINGAHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Well Name: ECW (X)5-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

06:00 09:00 3.0 DRILL F/3897'- TO/4087'. 15-25K WOB, 60-70 ROTARY,62 RPM MUD MUTOR. 105 SPM, 388 GPM, STD. PIPE

1161 PS1, DIF. 208 PSI., ROP 63 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK& REMAKE EACHCONNECTION.)

09:00 10:00 1.0 CIRCULATE FOR 15 MINUTES. CHECK FLOW (NO FLOW). SURVEY @ 4087' BIT DEFTH, 4009' SURVEY

DEPTH. SURVEY = 2.00 DEGREES.

10:00 13:30 3.5 DRILL F/4087'- TO/4277'. 15-25K WOB, 60-70 RUTARY, 62 RPM MUD MUTOR, 105 SPM, 388 GPM, STD. PIPE

I 161 PSI, DIF 208 PSI., ROP 54 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICE & LUBRICATE RIG. HELD BOP DRILL WlDAYLIGHT CREW, HAND TO STATIONS & SHUT IN 1MIN.
& 34 SEC.

14:00 20:30 6.5 DRILL F/4277'-TO/4658'. 15-25K WOB, 60-70 RUTARY,62 RPM MUD MUTOR, 105 SPM, 388GPM, STD. PIPE
1161 PSI, DIF. 208 PSI., ROP 59 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

20:30 21:30 1.0 CIRCULATE FOR 15 MINUTES.CHECK FLOW (NO FLOW). SURVEY @ 4658' BIT DEFTH, 4580' SURVEY
DEFTH.SURVEY = 1.50 DEGREES.

21:30 03:00 5.5 DRILL F/4658'- TO/4848'. 15-20K WOB, 60-70 RGIARY, 62 RPM MUD MOTOR, 105 SPM, 388 GPM, STD. PIPE

1280 PSI, DIF. 208 PSI., ROP 36 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACHCONNECTION.)

HELD BOP DRILL 2 MIN. 5 SEC. HANDSTO STATIONS & SHUT IN.

03:00 04:00 1.0 REPAIR CHAIN DRIVE BOX TORQUE WHEEL. TIGHTEN CHAIN DRIVE.

04:00 06:00 2.0 DRILL F/4848'- TO/4913'. 15-20K WOB, 60-70 RUFARY, 62 RPM MUD MUTOR, 105 SPM, 388 GPM, STD. PIPE

1280 PSI, DIF. 208 PSI., ROP 33 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: WELL CONTROL PROCEDURE'S & POISTIONS.

NOACCIDENTSTHE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS 1 DAY & l NIGHT.

SHORT 1 PERSONON MORNINGTOUR.

FUEL ON HAND 3583 GAL.

FUEL USED 1083 GAL.

35 DAYSNO LTA'S.

CHECKCROWN-O-MATIC/WORKING PROPERLY.

BOP DRILL MORNINGTOUR 1 MIN 34 SEC.

BOP DRILL EVENING TOUR 2 MIN 5 SEC.

LITHOLOGY :

50% SANDSTONE

40% SHALE

10% LIMESTONE

FORMATION:GREEN RIVER

BACK GROUND GAS: 15-25 U.

CONN. GAS 10-250 U.

HIGH GAS @ 4079', 1945 U.

04-10-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling $30,643 Completion 50 Daily Total $30,643

Cum Costs: Drilling $704,342 Completion 50 Well Total $704,342

MD 5,580 TVD 5,580 Progress 667 Days 4 MW 9.3 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0 -

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description

Page



Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL F/4913'- TO/4944'. 15-20K WOB, 60-70 RUTARY,62 RPM MUD MOTOR, 105 SPM, 388 GPM, STD. PIPE
1280 PSI, DIE 208 PSI., ROP 21 FPH. (MAKE l BREAK & REMAKEEACHCONNECTION.)

07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG. WAIT ON NEW DRILLER& DERRICKMAN. TO CONTINUE DRILLING.
08:00 17:30 9.5 DRILL F/4944' -TO/5230'. 15-20K WOB, 35-55 ROTARY, 62 RPM MUD MOTOR, 105 SPM, 388 GPM, STD. PIPE

1280 PSI, DIF. 208 PSI., ROP 30 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

17:30 18:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC. MECHANICS HOOKED HORN UP TO REMOTE STATIONON RIG
FLOOR.

18:00 22:00 4.0 DRILL F/5230'- TO/5327'. 15-20K WOB. 35-55 ROTARY, 62 RPM MUD MGTOR, 105 SPM, 388 GPM, STD. PIPE
1280 PSI, DIF. 208 PSI., ROP24 FPH. (MAKE/ BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

22:00 22:30 0.5 CIO ROT. HEAD RUBBER, INSTALLED NEW DRIVE BUSHING ON KELLY ORIGINAL BUSHINGTOO SMALL
TO WORK PROPERLY.

22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL F/5327'-TO/5580'. 15-20K WOB, 35-55 ROTARY, 62 RPM MUD MUTOR, 105 SPM, 388 GPM, STD. PIPE
1325 PSI, DIF. 222 PSI., ROP 34 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

MUD WT - 9.4 / 40

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: PROPER USE OF POWER TONGS.

NO ACCIDENTSTHE LAST 24 HOURS.
TWO PUSHERS 1 DAY & 1 NIGHT

FULL CREWS.

FUEL ON HAND 2583 GAL.

FUEL USED 1000 GAL.

36 DAYS NO LTA'S.

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC/WORKING PROPERLY.

LITHOLOGY :

40% SANDSTONE

30% SHALE

30% RED SHALE
FORMATION: CHAPITA WELLS @ 5510'.

BACK GROUND GAS: 50-90 U.

CONN. GAS 100-200 U.

HIGH GAS @4827', 241 U.

04-11-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

Daily Costs: Drilling $43,586 Completion 50 Daily Total $43,586

Cum Costs: Drilling 5747,958 Completion $0 WeH Total 5747,958

MD 5.789 TVD 5.789 Progress 209 Days 5 MW 9.4 Visc 51.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WASH & REAM

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 12:00 6.0 DRILLF/5580'- TO/5789'. 15-20K WOB, 35-55 ROTARY, 62 RPM MUD MUTOR, 105 SPM, 388 GPM, STD. PIPE

1325 PSI, DIF. 222 PSI., ROP 35 FPH. (MAKE / BREAK & REMAKE EACH CONNECTION.)

12:00 13:00 1.0 CIRCULÄI'E, MIX & PUMP SLUG FOR TRIR DROP SURVEY.HOLD PJSM BEFORE TRIP.

13:00 17:00 4.0 POOH W/ BIT & BHA #1. PULL ROTATEING HEAD ELEMENT @ HWDP.

17:00 19:00 2.0 POOH W/HWDP & D.C., LD/ROLLER REAMER'S & MUD MOTOR. WELL BORE TOOK PROPER FILL ON TRIP
OUT. HELD PJSM ON LAYINGDOWN BHA. (DID NOT GET A SURVEY.)

19:00 23:00 4.0 P/U BIT #2 & BHA #2 TIH WlBHA. (FUNCTIONED BLIND RAMS, PIPE RAMS & ANNULAR FROM REMOTE
STATION.)
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

23:00 (X):00 1.0 TIGHTEN DRILL LINEON DRAWWORKS.

00:00 02:00 2.0 TlHT/2820'.

02:00 03:00 1.0 ADJUST BRAKES.(BRAKE ASSIST NEED TO BE ADJUSTED)

03:00 05:30 2.5 TlH HIT TIGHT SPOT @ 5378', COCKED JARS & JARED UP @ 175k, STRING WT 145K. P/U 150K. PIPE FREE
L/DN 2-SINGLES.

05:30 06:00 0.5 P/U & M/U KELLYBREAKCIRCULATION.

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGSON: MIXINGCHEMICALS& HANDLINGBHA.

06:00 AM, MUD WT.9.4 PPG, 60 VIS.

NO ACCIDENTS THE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS I DAY & 1 NIGHT.

I HAND QUITE ON EVENING TOUR 1 FULL CREW.

FUEL REC. 4000 GAL

FUEL ON HAND 5833 GAL.

FUEL USED 755 GAL.

37 DAYSNO LTA'S.

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC/WORKING PROPERLY.

LITHOLOGY :

50% SANDSTONE

25% SHALE

25% RED SHALE

FORMATION: CHAPITA WELLS @ 5510'.

BACK GROUND GAS: 50-80 U.

CONN. GAS 120-500 U.

HIGH GAS @ 4827', 241 U.

04-12-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling $34,023 Completion $0 Daily Total 534,023

Cum Costs: Drilling 5781,514 Completion $0 Well Total 5781,514

MD 6,044 TVD 6,044 Progress 275 Days 6 MW 9.5 Visc 46.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: REPAIR PASSON EQUIPMENT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 WASH & REAM F/5430' - T/5490', 100 SPM, 910 PS1, 0-10 K WOB, 70 RPM RT, 370 GPM, 59 RPM MM.

ROTARY BRAKE CAUGHT ON FIRE PUT FIRE OUT & DISCONNECT ROTARY BRAKE. (SAFETY MEETING
100% TIE OFF WORKING AT HIGHT'S.)

09:00 10:00 1.0 FlNISH TIH TO 5769', NO MORE TIGHT SPOTSOR WELL BORE PROBLEMS ENCOUNTERED. ACTUAL WELL

BORE DEffH ADJUSTED TO 5769' NOT 5789'.

10:00 15:30 5.5 DRILLINGFI 5769' - TO/ 5821', 15 - 20 K WOB, 45-70 RPM, 105-110 SPM, 388-407 GPM, 62-65 RPM MUD

MOTOR, 9 FPH. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONS ON NEW DP.) RAISE MUD WT TO 9.9 PPG
FROM 9.4 PPG, DUE TO SLUFFING WELL BORE,VIS 39-43. TAKING 11.2PPGFROM PREMIXTANKS TO
ACTIVETO RAISE MUD WT. (HELD BOP DRILL HANDS TO STATIONS& WELL SECURE IN 2MIN 45 SEC.)

15:30 16:00 0.5 LUBRICATE & SERVICE RIG.

16:00 05:30 13.5 DRILLINGF/ 5821'- TO/ 6044', 15 - 20 K WOB, 45-70 RPM, 105-110 SPM, 388-407 GPM, 62-65 RPM MUD

MOTOR, 17 FPH. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKECONNECTIONSON NEW DP.)

CLEANEDAND DRIFTEDPRODUCTION CSG.
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

05:30 06:00 0.5 CIRCULATEPUMP SWEEP AROUND. WAIT ON PASSON TO ARRIVE TO REPAIROR REPLACECOMPUTER ON
RIG FLOOR. WILL NOT REMAIN BOOTED UP FOR MOR THEN TWO MINUTES.

HAD TROUBLE STARTING @ 01:30 THIS MORNING.

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: 100% TIE OFF WORKING AT HIGHT'S, SAFTEY MAKING CONNECTIONS..

06:00 AM, MUD WT.9.8 PPG, 37 VIS.
NO ACCIDENTSTHE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS 1 DAY & 1 NIGHT.

I HAND SHORT ON EVENINGTOUR, 1 FULL CREW.

FUEL REC. 0 GAL.

FUELON HAND 4999 GAL.
FUEL USED 834 GAL.

38 DAYSNO LTA'S.
CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC/WORKING PROPERLY.

LITHOLOGY :

55% SANDSTONE

20% SHALE
25% RED SHALE

FORMATION: CHAPITA WELLS @ 5510'.

BACK GROUND GAS: 70-80 U.

CONN. GAS: 90-130 U.
TRIP GAS: 486U @ 5769'.
HIGHGAS: 131U@ 5790'.

04-13-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling 533,056 Completion $0 Daily Total $33,056
Cum Costs: Drilling $813,750 Completion $0 WeH Total $813,750

MD 6,488 TVD 6,488 Progress 444 Days 7 MW 9.7 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 CIRCULATEPUMP SWEEP AROUND. WAIT ON PASSON TO ARRIVE TO REPAIROR REPLACECOMPUTER ON

RIG FLOOR.

07:00 12:00 5.0 DRILLING F/ 6044' - TO/ 6167', 15 - 20 K WOB, 45-70 RPM, 105-110 SPM, 388-407 GPM, 62-65 RPM MUD
MOTOR, 25 FPH. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONS ON NEW DP.)

12:00 13:00 1.0 SERVICE RIG & INSTALLNEW PASSONMONITOR ON RIG FLOOR.
13:00 06:00 17.0 DRILLING F/ 6167'- TO/ 6488', 15 - 20 K WOB, 40-70 RPM, 105-110 SPM, 388-407 GPM, 62-65 RPM MUD

MOTOR, 19 FPH. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONSON NEW DP.). USINGMUD FROMPRE MIX
TANKS FOR WT. UP & SWEEPS.

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGSON: SAFETYWORKINGWITH RGF

BOP DRILL2 MIN 48 SEC HANDSTO STATIONS.
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WellName: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITADEEP Property: 056062

JSA ON ROT MAINTANENCE & USE.

06:00 AM, MUD WT.9.9 PPG, 36 VIS.

NOACCIDENTS THE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS 1 DAY & 1 NIGHT.

FULL CREWS.

FUEL REC. OGAL.

FUEL ON HAND 3916 GAL.

FUEL USED 1083 GAL.

39 DAYSNO LTA'S.

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC/WORKING PROPERLY.

GROSS PRODUCTION CSG;10.012.40', NET CSG 9,915.92'.

LITHOLOGY :

50% SANDSTONE

25% SHALE

25% RED SHALE

FORMATION: BUCK CANYON @ 6170'.

BACK GROUND GAS: 70-90 U.

CONN. GAS: 100-140 U.

TRIP GAS: NA.

HIGH GAS: 207U @ 6210'.

04--14-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling $31,192 Completion 50 Daily Total 531,192

Cum Costs: Drilling $843,640 Completion $0 Well Total 5843,640

MD 7,010 TVD 7,010 Progress 522 Days 8 MW 10.0 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLINGAHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 16:30 10.5 DRILLINGF/ 6488' - TO/ 6747', 15 - 20 K WOB, 4Œ-70 RPM, 105-110 SPM, 388-407 GPM, 62-65 RPM MUD

MOTOR. 25 FPH. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONS ON NEW DP.). USINGMUD FROM PRE MIX

TANKS FOR WT. UP & SWEEPS.

16:30 17:30 1.0 WORK ON #1 & #2 MUD PUMPSTURN RPM'S UP ON MØTOR'S TO GET MORE STROKESFROM PUMPS. #1

MAX STROKES 115, #2 MAX STROKES 125.

17:30 06:00 12.5 DRILLINGFI 6747'- TO/7010', 15 - 25 K WOB, 40-70 RPM, 110-120 SPM, 407-443 GPM, 65-71 RPM MUD

MUTOR. 21 FPH. ( MAKE& BREAK& REMAKE CONNECTIONSON NEW DP.). USINGMUD FROM PRE MIX
TANKS FOR WT. UP & SWEEPS.

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: SAFETY CLEANING & WORKING AROUND ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT.

06:00 AM, MUD WT. 10.1 PPG, 38 VIS.

NO ACCIDENTSTHE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS 1 DAY& 1 NIGHT.

FULL CREWS.

FUEL REC. OGAL.

FUEL ON HAND 2666 GAL.

FUEL USED 1250 GAL.

40 DAYS NO LTA'S.
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

35% SHALE

15% RED SHALE

FORMATION: NORTH HORN @ 7070'.

BACKGROUND GAS: 90-100 U.
CONN. GAS: 100-140 U.

TRIP GAS: NA.

HIGH GAS: 440U @ 7112'.

04-16-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,052 Completion $0 Daily Total $27.052

Cum Costs: Drilling 5914,805 Completion $0 Well Total $914,805

MD 7,502 TVD 7.502 Progress 327 Days 10 MW 10.1 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING AHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 TIH FILL PIPE @ 3184', REAM LAST SINGLE TO BUITOM. COUNTED PIPE IN DERRICKTO INSURE PROPER

NUMBER OF STANDS.(COUNTED DP ON LCATION 171 JT'S, 189 JT'S IN WELL BORE, TUTAL OF 360 JTS IS
CORRECT.)

1I:00 1I:30 0.5 WASH/REAM F/ 7153' - T/ 7175', HAD 2' OF FILL ON BØTTOM, NO TIGHT SPOTS. 60 RPM RT, I 15 SPM, 425
GPM, 0--5K WOB, 64 RPM MUD MUTOR.

11:30 15:30 4.0 DRILLING F/ 7175'-TO/7216', 15 - 25 K WOB, 40-70 RPM, 110-120 SPM, 407-443 GPM, 61-66 RPM MUD
MOTOR. 10 FPH. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONS ON NEW DP.). USINGMUD FROM PRE MIX
TANKS FOR WT. UP & SWEEPS. (RAISE MUD WT TO 10.5 PPG FROM 10.3+ PPG.)

15:30 16:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG.
16:00 06:00 14.0 DRILLING F/ 7216' - TO/ 7502', 15 - 30 K WOB, 35-70 RPM, 110-120 SPM, 407-443 GPM, 61-66 RPM MUD

MOTOR. 20 FPH, 208 DIF. PSI, STD PIPE PSI 1871. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONS ON NEW DP.)
USING MUD FROM PRE MIX TANKSFOR WT. UP & SWEEPS.

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: KEEPING MIND ON WORK.

06:00 AM, MUD WT. 10.6 PPG, 42 VIS.

NO ACCIDENTS THE LAST 24 HOURS.
TWO PUSHERS 1 DAY & l NIGHT.

FULL CREWS.

FUEL REC. OGAL.

FUEL ON HAND 5333 GAL.

FUEL USED 916 GAL.

42 DAYS NO LTA'S.

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC/WORKING PROPERLY.

LITHOLOGY :

45% SANDSTONE

45% SHALE

10% SILTSTONE

FORMATION: PRICE RIVER @ 7370'.

BACK GROUND GAS: 100-200 U.

CONN. GAS: 150-1200 U.

TRIP GAS: 854U @ 7175'.

HIGH GAS: 1890U@ 7297'.
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

04-17-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling $36,333 Completion 50 Daily Total 536,333

Cum Costs: Drilling $951.138 Completion 50 Well Total $951,138

MD 8,169 TVD 8,169 Progress 667 Days 11 MW 10.4 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLINGAHEAD

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 16:00 10.0 DRILLING F/ 7502'- TO/7770', 15 - 30 K WOB, 35-70 RPM, 110-120 SPM, 407-443 GPM, 61-66 RPM MUD
MOTOR, 27 FPH, 208 DIE PSI, STD PIPE PSI 1871. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONS ON NEW DP).

16:00 16:30 0.5 REPAIR TRANSMISSION #2 PUMP OVER HEATING & TEST SAME. GOOD TO USE.

16:30 17:00 0.5 DRILLING F/ 7770' - TO/ 7788', 15 - 30 K WOB, 35-70 RPM, 110-120 SPM, 407-443 GPM, 61-66 RPM MUD
MOTOR, 36 FPH, 250 DIF. PSI, STD PlPE PSI 1871. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONSON NEW DP).

17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC.

17:30 06:00 12.5 DRILLING Fl 7788' - TO/ 8169', 15 - 30 K WOB, 35-70 RPM, 110-120 SPM, 407-443 GPM, 61-66 RPM MUD
MOTOR, 30 FPH, 200 DIF. PSI, STD PIPE PSI 1932. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONSON NEW DP).

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: HOUSE KEEPINGIMAKING CONNECTIONS.

06:00 AM, MUD WT. 10.8 PPG, 41 VIS.

NOACCIDENTSTHE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS 1 DAY & 1 NIGHT.

DAY TOUR 2 HANDS SHORT.

FUEL REC. OGAL.

FUEL ON HAND 3984 GAL.

FUEL USED 1328 GAL.

43 DAYS NO LTA'S.

CHECKCROWN-O-MATIC/WORKING PROPERLY.

LITHOLOGY :

55% SANDSTONE

35% SHALE

10% SILT STONE

FORMATION:PRICE RIVER @ 7370'.

BACK GROUND GAS: 120-250 U.

CONN. GAS: 150-350 U.

TRIP GAS: NA.

HIGH GAS: 3979U @ 7815'.

04-18-2007 Reported By TERRY BEHREND

DailyCosts: Drilling 555,630 Completion $0 Daily Total $55,630

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,006,769 Completion $0 Well Total S1,006,769

MD 8,833 TVD 8,833 Progress 664 Days 12 MW 10.8 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILLINGF/ 8169'- TO/ 8328', 15-30 K WOB, 35-70 RPM, 110-120 SPM, 407-443 GPM, 61-66 RPM MUD
MUTOR, 23 FPH, 200 DIE PSI, STD PIPE PSI 1932. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONS ON NEW DP)
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICERIG. CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC.

13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILLING F/ 8328'- TO/ 8833', 15-30 K WOB, 35-70 RPM, l10-120 SPM, 407-443 GPM, 61-66 RPM MUD

MOTOR, 30 FPH, 110-200 DIF.PSI, STD PIPE PSI 1950. ( MAKE & BREAK & REMAKE CONNECTIONSON NEW

DP.). BOP DRILL HELD.

HELDSAFTEYMEETINGSON: MIXINGCHEMICALS/JSA ON RIG SERVICE.

06:00 AM, MUD WT. 10.9+ PPG, 41 VIS.

NOACCIDENTS THE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS 1 DAY & 1 NIGHT.

FULL CREWS.

FUEL REC.OGAL.

FUEL ON HAND 2416 GAL.

FUEL USED 1568 GAL.

44 DAYSNO LTA'S.

CHECK CROWN-O-MAflC/WORKING PROPERLY.

BOP DRILL: 86 SECONDS.

LlTHOLOGY :

60% SANDSTONE

30% SHALE

10% SILT STONE

FORMATION: MIDDLEPRICE RIVER @ 8350'.

BACKGROUND GAS: 60-200 U.

CONN. GAS: 200-1750 U.

TRIP GAS: NA.

HIGH GAS: 2332U @ 8573'.

04-19-2007 Reported By T. BEHRENDIC.ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling 550,778 Completion 50 Daily Total $50,778

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,057,548 Completion $0 Well Total $1,057,548

MD 9,209 TVD 9,209 Progress 376 Days 13 MW I 1.2 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:30 7.5 DRILLING FI 8833'- TO 8,960', 15-30 K WOB, 35-70 RPM, 110-120 SPM, 407-443 GPM, 61-66 RPM MUD

MOTOR,-- FPH, 110-200 DIF.PSI, STD PIPE PSI 1950. ( MAKE & BREAK& REMAKECONNECTIONS ON NEW

DP.).

13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, ADJUST BRAKES

14:00 06:00 16.0 DRLG.FROMF/ 8960' TO 9209'- WOB 10/25 K - 105 / 115 SPM 387 / 424 GPM - M. MGTOR 62 RPM - R. TABLE

50n0 RPM - STD. PIPE 1750 / 2100 PSI. - DIF PRESSURE 80 /300 PSI - MW 11.4 - VIS. 40

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: PICK UP PIPE, FUNCTIONTEST CROWN-O-MATIC

NO ACCIDENTS THE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS 1 DAY & I NIGHT.

DAY TOUR 1 HAND SHORT

FUEL ON HAND 5.644 GAL.

FUEL USED 1.272 GAL.
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

45 DAYS NO LTA'S.

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC/WORKING PROPERLY.

BOP DRILL: 90 SECONDS.

LITHOLOGY :

35% SANDSTONE

55% SHALE

10% SILT STONE

FORMATION: LOWERPRICE RIVER @ 9.010'.

BACKGROUND GAS: 150 -300 U.

CONN. GAS: 200-1800 U.

HIGHCONN. GAS: 3.773 U @ 8.884'
04-20-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $34,410 Completion 50 Daily Total $34,410
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,091,958 Completion $0 Well Total $1,091,958

MD 9.209 TVD 9,209 Progress 159 Days 14 MW 11.2 Visc 36.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: TIH W/ BHA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILLING F/9209' TO 9367 '- WOB 15/30 K - 100/115 SPM - 370/424 GPM -- M. MOTOR 62 RPM -TABLE 50/70

RPM - STD. PIPE PRESS. 1700/2200 PSI. - FIFF. PRESS. 100/300 PSI
17:00 17:30 0.5 MUD MOTOR LOCK UP, PRESS. UP TO 2.500 PSI W/ 108 SPM, RELEASE MUD PUMP, M. MOTOR HOLD 500 PSI

W/ PUMP OFF. CHANGE TO # 2 PUMP, SAME.
17:30 18:00 0.5 TRY TO PUMP HEAVYPILL (12.5 PPG), PILL WASNGT SUCCESSFUL
18:00 02:00 8.0 TOH WITH WET PIPE

02:00 04:00 2.0 BREAK BIT, LAY DOWN M. MUTOR, FUNCTION TEST BOP, PICK UP BIT SUB & BIT RR #2 HUGHES 506Z

04:00 05:00 1.0 WORK ON TRANSMITION OF # 2 MOTOR
05:00 06:00 1.0 TIH W/ BIT # 2 RR

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: TRIP OUT HOLE

NOACCIDENTSTHE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS, 1 DAY & 1 NIGHT.

DAY & NIGTH TOUR 1 HAND SHORT

FUEL ON HAND 4.666 GAL.
FUEL USED 978 GAL.

46 DAYSNO LTA'S.
CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC/WORKINGPROPERLY.

BOP DRILL:

LITHOLOGY :

30% SANDSTONE

55% SHALE

15% SILT STONE

FORMATION: LOWER PRICE RIVER @ 9.010'.
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

BACK GROUND GAS: 150 - 300 U.

CONN. GAS: 25 1600 U.

HIGH CONN. GAS: 2.610 U @ 9267'

04-21-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $37,383 Completion $0 Daily Total 537,383

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,122,526 . Completion 50 Well Total $1,122,526

MD 9,394 TVD 9,394 Progress 100 Days 15 MW 11.4 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 TIH W/ BIT # 2 RR TO 836' LAY DOWN DRILLINGJAR, TOP SEAL OUT

08:00 14:00 6.0 WORKINGON REPAIR TRANSMISION ON # 2 MOTOR, CHANGE OIL ON MOTOR TRANSMITION, REPAIR
HDY. SUCI'ION PIPE, MOTOR READY @ 02:15 PM

14:00 16:00 2.0 TIH TO 2500'

16:00 16:30 0.5 PICK KELLY, FILL PIPE, CIRCULATE

16:30 00:30 8.0 CONTINUE TIH, STRAP IN - FILL PIPE & CIRCULATE @ 5.950'- BRIDGE @ 6.870' P/UP KELLY REAM 30',
CONTINUE TRIP TO BTTM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 REAM 70' TO BTTM.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL F/ 9.294' TO 9.394 ' WOB 15/25 K - 85/90 RPM - 103 SPM, 1500 PSI - 379 GPM, - 73' CORR. ON STRAP IN
HOLE, STRAP 9.294' , PASON 9.367' - 73' CORR. I MUD WT 11.1 / 42 VIS.

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: TRIP IN HOLE

NO ACCIDENTSTHE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS, 1 DAY & 1 NIGHT.

DAY & NIGTH TOUR 1 HAND SHORT

FUEL ON HAND 4.150 GAL.

FUEL USED 516 GAL.

47 DAYSNO LTA'S.

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC/WORKING PROPERLY.

BOP DRILL:

LITHOLOGY :

30% SANDSTONE

60% SHALE

10% SILT STONE

FORMATION: LOWER PRICE RIVER @ 9.010'.

BACK GROUND GAS: 150 - 300 U.

CONN. GAS: 250-1600 U.

HIGH CONN. GAS: 2.610 U @ 9267'

04-22-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $31.371 Completion $0 Daily Total $31,371

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,153,897 Completion $0 Well Total $1,153,897

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 141 Days 16 MW 11.4 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNNING4 1/2" CSG
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:30 6.5 DRILL F/9.394 TO 9.535' TD - WOB 15/20 K - 85 RPM - 103 SPM, 379 GPM - MW 11.4 PPG, 39 VIS. REACHED
TD AT 12:30 HRS,4/21/07.

12:30 13:30 1.0 ClRCULATE COND. HOLE.

13:30 16:00 2.5 PUMP PILL & WlPER TRIP/SHORT TRIP TO 8.900'

16:00 18:00 2.0 CIRCULATE COND. MUD, PUMP PILL, RIG UP LAY-DOWN MACHINE, SAFETY MEETING

18:00 03:00 9.0 LDI4. 5" D. PIPE, HWDP,D. COLLARS. BEAK KELLY.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ATTEMPTTO PULL WEAR RING,WEAR RING BENT INSIDE, RETRIEVER TOOL WOULD NOT FIT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 RIG UP CASING EQUlPMENT, RUN 4 1/2" CASING11.6#,N80, LTC, RUN 3 JOINTS

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: LAY DOWN D. PIPE

NO ACCIDENTSTHE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS, 1 DAY & 1 NIGHT.

FULL CREW

FUEL ON HAND 3.237 GAL.

FUEL USED 913 GAL.

48 DAYS NO LTA'S.

CHECK CROWN-O-MATIC/WORKING PROPERLY.

BOP DRILL:

LITHOLOGY :

40% SANDSTONE

45% SHALE

15% SILT STONE

FORMATION: SEGO @ 9.330'.

BACK GROUND GAS: 500 - 600 U.
CONN. GAS: 700-1500 U.

TRIP GAS 2500 U @ 9.535'

HIGH CONN. GAS: 1.829 U @9.373'

04-23-2007 Reported By CARLOS ARRIETA

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,115 Completion $148,527 Daily Total $183,642

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion $148,527 WeH Total $1,337,540

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.6 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RDRT/WOCOMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 15:00 9.0 RUN 4 1/2" CASING, 11.6#, N-80, LTC, INSTALLED 15 CENTRALIZERS.(1) MARKER JOINT FROM 7319' TO

7341' (2) MARKERJOINT FROM 4405' TO 4427' TOTAL OF 237 JOINTS. LANDED SHOE AT 9537', WITH FC AT
9495'.

15:00 18:30 3.5 CIRCULATE FOR CASING, 85 SPM, 313 GPM, 600 PSI.
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WellName: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

18:30 11:30 3.0 CEMENT WISCHLUMBERGER & RIG CREW AS PER PROG. HELD 15 MlN. SAFETY MEETING,R/UP
CEMENT1NGHEAD,TEST LINETO 5.2(X) PSI OK, PUMP 20 BBLSWASH @ 7.7 BBLS/MIN.PUMP20 BBLS.
SPACER @ 7.7 BBLS/MIN. CEMENT CSG W/ 149 BBLS LEAD SLURRY ( 370 SKS) 35:65 POZ/G + ADDS (YIELD

= 2.26) H20 12.95 GALS./SKS MIX @ 12 PPG, PUMP @ 7.7 BBLS/MIN. PUMP TAIL SLURRY 356 BBLS( 1550

SKS) 50/50 POZ/G + ADDS (YlELD- 1.29) H2O 5.95 GAL/SKS, MIX @ 14.lPPG, PUMP @ 6.4 BBLS./MIN.

DISPLACE TO PLUG BUMP W/ 147.5 BBLS. TREATED FRESH WATER @ 6.2 / 2.0 BBLS./MIN. PRESS. 2321 PSI

BEFORE PLUG LANDED, BUMPED PLUG TO 3500 PSI @ 19:58 PM, CHECK FLOATS, OK 1.5 BBLS. BACK.

HAVE POSITIVE RETURNS,RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER EQUlPMENTS.

21:30 03:00 5.5 NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S. SET CSG SLIP Wl80,000 LBS. CLEAN MUDTANKS.

03:00 06:00 3.0 RIGGING DOWN.

HELD SAFTEY MEETINGS ON: RUN CASING

NOACCIDENTSTHE LAST 24 HOURS.

TWO PUSHERS, 1 DAY & l NIGHT.

FULL CREW

FUEL ON HAND 2.905 GAL.

FUEL USED 332 GAL.

49 DAYS NO LTA'S.

CHECK CROWN-4)-MATIC/WORKINGPROPERLY.

BOP DRILL:

TRIP GAS 9.450 U @ 9.535'

06:00 RIG RELEASE @ 03:00 HRS, 4/23/2007.

CASING POINT COST $1,189,014

04-27-2007 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $44,988 Daily Total $44,988

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion $193,515 WeH Total $1,382,528

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU SCHLUMBERGER. LOG WITH RST/CBL/CCUVDL/GR FROM PBTD TO 780'. EST CEMENT TOP @ 1150'.

RD SCHLUMBERGER.

05-05-2007 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $2,030 Daily Total $2,030

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189.013 Completion $195,545 Well Total $1.384,558

MD 9.535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

13:00 14:00 1.0 NU 10M FRAC TREE. PRESSURE TESTED FRAC TREE & CASINGTO 6500 PSIG. WO COMPLETION.

05-12-2007 Reported By DEAN KOUTROULIS

Daily Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $6,985 Daily Total 56,985
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Well Name: ECW (X)5-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion $202,530 Well Total $1,391,543
MD 9.535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days- 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7844-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0 .

Activity at Report Time: FRAC

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATED LPR FROM9211-13', 9221-22', 9239-40', 9275-76', 9282-83', 9291-92', 9296-

97', 9335-36', 9351-52' & 9388-91' @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED DOWN
CASINGWITH 165 GAL GYVI'RON T-106, 4184 GAL YF116ST+ PAD & 46097 GAL YF116ST+WITH 137500#
20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6112 PSIG. MTR 45.8 BPM. ATP 4578 PSIG. ATR 43 BPM. ISIP 2716 PSIG. RD
SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 9160'. PERFORATED LPR FROM 8867-68'. 8886-87', 8898-99', 8918-19', 8941-42',
8964-65', 8986-87', 9031-32', 9057-58', 9083-84', 9096-97', 9143-44' & 9211-13' @ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING.
RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACEDDOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 5158 GAL YF116ST+
PAD & 42877 GAL YFl l6ST+ WITH 131200#20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6617 PSIG. MTR 45.5 BPM.ATP 5846
PSIG. ATR 34.7 BPM. ISIP 3250 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 8840'. PERFORATED MPR FROM8661-62', 8669-70', 8674-75', 8698-99', 8705-06',
8737-38', 8765-66', 8774-75', 8801-04' & 8815-16' @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRACEDDOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYVIRONT-106, 4166 GAL YF116ST+ PAD & 47804 GAL YFl16ST+
WITH 141800# 20/40 SAND @ 14 PPG. CUT JOB SHORT DUE TO PRESSURE1NCREASE.MTP 6254 PSIG. MTR
45.4 BPM.ATP 5527 PSIG. ATR 41.5 BPM. ISIP 3940 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 8615'. PERFORATED MPR FROM8420-2 l', 8436-37', 8469-70', 8476-77', 8507-08',
8514-15', 8525-26', 854647', 8569-70', 8577-78', 8590-91' & 8600-02' @ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYRI'RONT-106, 4149 GAL YF116ST+ PAD &
51224 GAL YF116ST+ WITH 159000# 20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6410 PSIG. MTR 45.7 BPM. ATP 5290 PSIG.
ATR 42.8 BPM. ISIP 2630 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 8395'. PERFORATED MPR FROM 8127-28', 8140-41', 8181-82', 8197-98', 8217-18',
8239-40', 8274-75', 8283-84', 8322-23', 8335-36', 8354-55' & 8371-72' @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING.RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER.FRACED DOWN CASINGW1TH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4132 GALYF1165T+ PAD &
51101 GAL YFl16ST+ WITH 158000#20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP6218 PSIG. MTR 48.3 BPM. ATP4307 PSIG.
ATR 45.2 BPM. ISIP 2750 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 8060'. PERFORATED UPR FROM 7844-45', 7850-51', 7881-82', 7906-47', 7919-20',
7950-51', 7966-67', 8003-06', 8044-45' & 8049-50' @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRACED DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4137 GALYF116ST+ PAD& 43199 GALYF116ST+
WITH 132500#20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 6191 PSIG. MTR48.8 BPM. ATP 4493 PSIG.ATR45.4 BPM. ISIP 3000PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER. SDFN.

05-13-2007 Reported By DEAN KOUTROULIS

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion 5322,073 Daily Total $322,073
Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion 5524,603 Well Total $1,713,616
MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: PREP TO MIRUSU

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RUWL. SET 10KCFP AT 7800'. PERFORATEDUPR FROM7601-02', 7611-12', 7634-35', 7658-59', 7664-65',

7686-87', 7721-23', 7732-33', 7750-51', 7756-57' & 7760-61' @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYFTRON T-106, 4157 GAL YF116ST+PAD&
51032 GALYF116ST+ WITH 157500#20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 5253 PSIG. MTR 49 BPM. ATP3640 PSIG.ATR
42.8 BPM, ISIP 2480 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

Page



Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 7575'. PERFORATED UPR FROM 7374-75', 7399-400', 7414-15', 7449-51', 7476-77',
7523-24', 7538-40'.7549-50' & 7556-58' @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING.RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED
DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4151 GAL YF116ST+ PAD & 52144 GAL YF116ST+ WITH
137720# 20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 5890 PSIG. MTR 48.3 BPM.ATP 4197 PSIG.ATR 45.9 BPM. ISIP 2800 PSIG.
RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CBP AT 7291'. BLED OFF PRESSURE.RDWL. SDFN.

05-16-2007 Reported By HISLOP

Daily Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $15.493 Daily Total $15,493

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion 5540,096 Well Total $1,729,109

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILL CFPS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU ROYAL WELL SERVICE RIG #2. SICP0 PSIG. ND FRAC VALVE.NU BOP. RIH WITH 3-7/8" MILL TOOTH
BlT, POBS, 1 JT 2-3/8" N-80 8RD 4.7#, XN, 222 JTS TUBlNG TO CBP @ 7291'. SWI. SDFD.

05-17-2007 Reported By MCCAMENT

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $33,329 Daily Total 533,329

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion $573.425 Well Total $1.762,438

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 16:00 10.0 SICP 0 PSIG. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @ 7291', 7575', 7800'. 8060', 8395', 8615', 8840' &
9160'. RIH. CLEANEDOUT TO PBTD @ 9494'. LANDED TBG @ 8001' KB. ND BOPE. NUTREE. PUMPEDOFF
BIT & SUB. RDMOSU.

FLOW 14 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1450 PSIG. CP 1550 PSIG.44 BPH. RECOVERED 604 BLW. 10652 BLWTR.

TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

PUMP OFF SUB 1.91'

1 JT 2 3/8" 4.7# N-80 TBG 32.66'

XN NIPPLE 1.10'

242 JTS 2 3/8" 4.7# N-80 TBG 7945.54'

BELOW KB 20.00'

LANDED @ 8001.21' KB

05-18-2007 Reported By MCCAMENT

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $900 Daily Total $900

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion $574,325 Well Total $1.763,338

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRACFLOWBACK
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1400 PSIG. CP 1850 PSIG. 40 BPH. RECOVERED 956 BLW. 9896 BLWTR.

05-19-2007 Reported By MCCURDY

Daily Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $2,750 Daily Total $2,750

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion 5577,075 Well Total $1,766.088

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1200 PSIG. CP 2250 PSIG. 36 BPH. RECOVERED844 BLW. 8852 BLWTR.

JRS

05-20-2007 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $2,225 Daily Total $2,225

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion $579,300 Well Total $1,768,313

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1200 PSIG. CP 2400 PSIG. 32 BPH. RECOVERED 744 BLW. 8108 BLWTR.

JRS

05-21-2007 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,225 Daily Total $2,225

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion $581,525 Well Total $1,770,538

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 1150 PSIG. CP 2550 PSIG. 27 BFPH. RECOVERED 648 BLW. 7460 BLWTR.
SI. WO FACILITIES.

FINAL COMPLETION DATE: 5/20/07

06-05-2007 Reported By DUANE COOK

Daily Costs: Drilling SO Completion $2,225 Daily Total $2,225

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion $581,525 Well Total $1,770,538

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 INITIAL PRODUCTION. OPENINGPRESSURE: TP 1200 & CP 3100 PSI. TURNED WELL TO QUESTAR SALES AT
11:50 AM, 6/4/07. FLOWED 190 MCFD RATEON 12/64" POS CHOKE. STAITC332.
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property:056062

06-06-2007 Reported By ROGER DART

Daily Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189.013 Completion $581,525 Well Total $1,770,538

MD 9.535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 274 MCFD, 30 BC & 340 BW IN 24 HRS ON 12/64" CK, TP 2625 & CP 3150 PSIG.

06-07-2007 Reported By ALANWATKINS

Daily Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion $581,525 WeH Total $1,770,538

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0 0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 450 MCFD, 30 BC & 300 BW IN 24 HRSON 12/64" CK, TP 1500 & CP 2800 PSIG.

06-08-2007 Reported By ALAN WATKINS

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,189,013 Completion $581,525 Well Total $1,770,538

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 00

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0 0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 0 MCFD, OBC & 300 BW IN 24 HRS ON 12/64" CK, TP 1500 & CP 2800 PSIG. SWI TO INSULATE

TANKS.
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Eorm3\60-4 UNITED STATES
(February 2005) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR FORMAPPROVED

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT E pr s Ma 3 ,2 07

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. Lease Serial No.
U-01304

la Type of Well Oil Well Gas Well Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b TypeofCompletion: New Well QWorkOver CDeepen GPlugBack ODiff Resvr.,

Other
7 Unit or CA Agreement Name and No

2. Nameof0perator EOGRESOURCES,INC 8. Lease Nameand Well No
East Chapita 5-5

3. Address 600 17th Street, Suite 1000N, Denver, CO 80202 3a Phone No. (include area code) 9. AFI Well No.
303-262-2812 43-047-36490

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and inaccordance with Federal requirements)* 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
Natural Buttes/Mesaverde

At surface 601' FNL & 631' FEL (NENE) 40.070342 LAT 109.343772 LON 11. Sec., T., IL, M., on Block and

At top prod.interval reported below Same
Surveyor Area Sec. ET95-R23E

12 Countyor Parish 13. State
At totaldepth Same Uintah County UT

14 Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16 DateCompleted 06/04/2007 17 Elevations(DF,RKB,RT,GL)*

10/16/2006 04/21/2007 D & A Ready to Prod. 4943' GL

18. Total Depth: MD 9535' 19. Plug Back T.D: MD 9494' 20 Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD

TVD TVD TVD

21. Type Electric &Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22 Waswell cored? No OYes (Submit analysis)
WasDST run? No Yes (Submit report)

RST/CBL/CCL/VDL/GR DirectionalSurvey? No Des (Submitcopy)

21 Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

IIole Size Size/Grade Wt (#lft) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) StageCementer of SCN& I Slurr Vol. Cement Tope AmountPulled

12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36 J-55 0 - 2537 675 sx

7-7/8" 4-1/2 11.6 N-80 0 -9537 1920 sx

3[ Tubing Record
Size Depth Set(MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set(MD) PackerDepth(MD) Size Depth Set(MD) Packer Depth (MD)

2-3/8" 8001
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Fonnation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf Status

A) Mesaverde 7374 9391 9221 - 9391 3/spf

B) 8867 - 9213 2/sof

C) 8661-8816 3/spf

D) 8420 - 8602 2/sof

27 Acid, Fracture,Treatment,CementSqueeze,etc HEGEIVE
Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material

9221 - 9391 I 50,446 GALS GELLED WATER & 137,500# 20/40 SAND

8867 - 9213 48,200 GALS GELLED WATER & 131,200# 20/40 SAND
8661 - 8816 52,135 GALS GELLED WATER & 141,800# 20/40 SAND

8420 - 8602 55,538 GALS GELLED WATER & 159,000# 20/40 SAND UN.UEUIL,G
28. Production - Interval A

Dale First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method

Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravity

06/04/2007 06/13/2007 24 60 290 265
FLOWING

Choke Tbg Press Cag- 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/0il Well Status

Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

:2/se Si izso 2sso so zoo zes
ruoouclNc

28a. Production - Interval B
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Graviiv Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Producton BBL MCF BBL Colt API Gravity

Choke Tbg Press Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

*(See instructions and spaces for additional data on page



28b.Production- IntervalC
DateFirst Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water OilGravity Gas ProductionMethod
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravity

Choke Tbg.Press. Cs8 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/Oil WellStatus
Size F1wg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production- IntervalD
DateFirst Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water OilGravity Gas ProductionMethod
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravity

Choke Tbg.Press. Csg. 24Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas/0il WellStatus
Size F1wg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas(Sold,usedforfuel,vented, etc.,

SOLD

30. Surmuy of PorousZones(Include Aquifers): 31. Formation(log) Markers

Showall important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Coredintervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depthinterval tested,cushion used, timetoolopen, flowingand shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents,etc. Name I°P
Meas.Depth

Mesaverde 7374 9391 Wasatch 4969
Chapita Wells 5554
Buck Canyon 6193
Mesaverde 7333
Middle Price River 8118
Lower Price River 8901
Sego 9423

32. Additional remarks (include pluggingprocedure):

See Attached Sheet.

33. Indicatewhich itemshavebeenattached byplacinga check intheappropriate boxes:

O ElectricallMechanical Logs (1 fullset req'd.) O GeologicRepon OosT Report ODirectional Survey

O SundryNotice forplugging and cement verification O coreAnalysis OOther:

34. I herebycertify thattheforegoingand attached informationis complete and correct as determinedfromall available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) Carrie MacDonald Title Operations Clerk

Signature Date 07/03/2007

Title 18U.S.C Section1001 and Title43 U.S.C Section1212, make it a crime forany person knowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United

Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matterwithin itsjurisdiction.

(Continuedon page 3) (Form 3160-4, page



East Chapita 5-3- ADDITIONAL REMARKS (CONTINUED):

26. PERFORATION RECORD

8127-8372 3/spf
7844-8050 3/spf

7601-7761 3/spf
7374-7558 3/spf

27. ACID, FRACTURE TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
8127-8372 55,398 GALS GELLED WATER & 158,000# 20/40 SAND

7844-8050 47,501 GALS GELLED WATER & 132,500#20/40 SAND

7601-7761 55,354 GALS GELLED WATER & 157,500# 20/40 SAND

7374-7558 56,460 GALS GELLED WATER & 137,720# 20/40 SAND

Perforated the Lower Price River from 9221-9222', 9239-9240', 9275-9276',

9282-9283', 9291-9292', 9296-9297', 9335-9336', 9351-9352', 9388-9391' wl 3

spf.

Perforated the Lower Price River from 8867-8868', 8886-8887', 8898-8899',

8918-8919', 8941-8942', 8964-8965', 8986-8987', 9031-9032', 9057-9058', 9083-

9084', 9096-9097', 9143-9144', 9211-9213' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 8661-8662', 8669-8670', 8674-8675',

8698-8699', 8705-8706', 8737-8738', 8765-8766', 8774-8775', 8801-8804', 8815-

8816' wl 3 spf.

Perforated the MiddlePrice River from 8420-8421', 8436-8437', 8469-8470',

8476-8477', 8507-8508', 8514-8515', 8525-8526', 8546-8547', 8569-8570', 8577-

8578', 8590-8591', 8600-8602' w/ 2



Perforated the Middle Price River from 8127-8128', 8140-8141', 8181-8182',

8197-8198', 8217-8218', 8239-8240', 8274-8275', 8283-8284', 8322-8323', 8335-

8336', 8354-8355', 8371-8372' w/ 3 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7844-7845', 7850-7851', 7881-7882',

7906-7907', 7919-7920', 7950-7951', 7966-7967', 8003-8006', 8044-8045', 8049-

8050' w/ 3 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7601-7602', 7611-7612', 7634-7635',

7658-7659', 7664-7665', 7686-7687', 7721-7723', 7732-7733', 7750-7751', 7756-

7757', 7760-7761' wl 3 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7374-7375', 7399-7400', 7414-7415',

7449-7451', 7476-7477', 7523-7524', 7538-7540', 7549-7550', 7556-7558' wl 3



STATE OF UTAH FORM 7
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

REPORT OF WATER ENCOUNTERED DURINGDRILLING

Well name and number: East Chapita 5-05

API number: 43-047-36490

Well Location: QQ LOT1 Section 5 Township 9S Range 23E County UINTAH

Well operator: EOG Resources, Inc.

Address: 1060 E HWY 40

city VERNAL state UT zip 84078 Phone: (435) 781-9111

Drilling contractor: BILL JR RATHOLE DRILLING

Address: 384 E 2500 S

city VERNAL state UT z¡p 84078 Phone: (435) 789-4729

Water encountered (attach additional pages as needed):

DEPTH VOLUME QUALITY

FROM TO (FLOW RATE OR HEAD) (FRESH OR SALTY)

2,080 2,090 NO FLOW NOT KNOWN

Formation tops: 1 2 3
(Top to Bottom)

4 5 6

8 9

10 11 12

Ifan analysis has been made of the water encountered, please attach a copy of the report to this form.

I hereby certify that this report is true and complete to the best of my knowledge.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT)
Carrie MacDonald TITLE Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
7/3/2007



IP date corrected from a previous submission dated 6/8/2007.

lenn 316tss UNITED STATES FORMMPROVED
(February 2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR ÑÌÊÛ\ 007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT i LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS "¯'"3"*

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6. If Indian,AllotteeorTnbeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CAiAgreement, Nameand/or No.

1. Type of II)il
Well GasWell Other 8. Well Name and Na

East Chapita 5-05
2. Nameof Dpemtor EOG Resources. Inc- 9. API Well No.
3a Address 3b. Phone No. tincluk wea c<xky 43-047-36490

600 17th Street. Suite 1000N. Denver, CO 80202 303-824-5526 10. Field and Pool,or ExploratorjArea

4. Location of Well (Frxnage. Sec..T. R, If, or Swwy Description) Natural Buttes/Mesaverde

601' FNL & 631' FEL (NENE)
I l. County or Parish, State

Sec.5-T9S-R23E 40.070342 LAT 109.343772 LON Uintah County. Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NØRCE REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Produchon (Sm Raume) Water Shut-Of
ONotice of Intent Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Wen Integnty

SubsequentReport Casing Repair New Construction Recomple e Other
O ChangePlans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O Final Abandonment Notice Convento injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Desenbe Proposed or CompletedOperation (clearly state all pertinent details,includingestimated staning date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor ocomplete honzontally,give subsurface kicationsand measured and truevertical depthsof all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will beperfonnedor provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30days
following completion of the involvedopemtions. If the operation results ina multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval.a Eonn 3160-4must be tiledonce
testing hasbeencompleted. Final Abandonment Notices must betiledonly atter all requirements, including reclamation, have beencompleted, and the operator has
deternined that the site is ready for tinalinspection.)

The referenced well was turned to sales on 5/21/2007.

14. 1hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name /Printed/Typed)

Mary A. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant

Signature Date 08/02/2007

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
4mF

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legalor equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18US.C.Section1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the Umted
States any false. fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

AUSO82007
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



IP DATE CORRECTED FROM A PREVIOUS SUBMISSION DATED 7/3/2007.
Form3160-4 (JNITED STATES(February XIli) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR FORM APPROVED

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT E0 BNO. I -012nOO7

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. Lease Serial No.
U-Ol304

la. Type of Well Oil Well Gas Well Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Typeof Completion: New Well Work Over CDeepen GPlug Back Diff Resvr.,

Other 7 Unit or CA Agreement Name and No

2. Name of Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC 8. Lease Name and Well No.
East Chapita 5-5

3. Address 600 17th Street, Suite 1000N, Denver, CO 80202 3a Phone No. (includearea code) 9. AFl¾II No.
303-262-2812 43-047-36490

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements). 10. Field anÏÑol,or Exploratory
Natural Buttes/Mesaverde

At surface 601' FNL & 631' FEL (NENE) 40.070342 LAT 109.343772 LON
I I. Sec., T., R., M., on Block and

At topprod. intervalreported below Same Surveyor Area Sec. 5-T98-R23E

12 Countyor Pansh 13. State
At totaldepth Same Uintah County UT

14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16 Date Completed 05/21/2007 17 Elevations (DF,RKB, RT,GL)*
10/16/2006 04/21/2007 D & A BReady to Prod. 4943' GL

18. Total Depth: MD 9535' 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 9494' 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD

TVD TVD TVD

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22. Was well cored? No OYes (Submit analysis)
Was DST run? No ges (Submitreport)

RSTICBL/CCL/VDL/CR
Directional Survey? No Des (Submitcopy)

21 Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

IIole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD)
Stage Cementer Noe

f
SCks& SluÑL)° Cement Tope Amount Pulled

12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36 J-55 0 - 2537 675 sx
7-7/8" 4-1/2 11.6 N-80 0 - 9537 1920 sx

X Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set(MD) Packer Depth (MD)

2-3/8" 8001
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Fornation Top Bottom PerforatedInterval Size No. Holes Perf Status
A) Mesaverde 7374 9391 9221 - 9391 3/spf
B) 8867 - 9213 2/spf
C) 8661 - 8816 3/spf
D) 8420 - 8602 2/spf
27. Acid, Fracture,Treatment, Cement Squeeze, etc.

Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
9221 - 9391 50,446 GALS GELLED WATER & 137,500# 20/40 SAND
8867 - 9213 48,200 GALS GELLED WATER & 131,200# 20/40 SAND
8661 - 8816 52.135 GALS GELLED WATER & 141,800# 20/40 SAND
8420 - 8602 55,538 GALS GELLED WATER & 159,000#20/40 SAND

28. Production - Interval A
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water OilGravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL CorrAPI Gravity

05/21/2007 06/13/2007 24 60 290 265 FLOWING

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/0il Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
:2744•• Si 1250 2550 60 290 265

PRODUCING

28a. Production - Interval B
Date First Test Hours Tes! Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Producton BBL MCF BBL Colt API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

si -+ RECEIVED
*(See instructions and spaces for additional data on page 2)

AUSO62007

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



28b.Production- IntervalC
DateFirst Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Gil (Travity Gas PnxiuctionMethod
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravity

Choke Tbg.Press. Csg. 24Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/0il Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production- Interval D
DateFirst Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water OilGravity Gas IhxinctionMethod
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravity

Choke Tbg.Poss. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas/Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

29. Dispositionof Gas(Sold,usedforfuel,vented, etc.,

SOLD

30. Sunumryof PtzousZones (Include Aquifen): 31. Formation (Ing) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Coredintervals and all drill-stem
tests,including depthinterval tested,cushion used, timetoolopen, flowingand shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions,Contents,etc. Name Meas Depth

Mesaverde 7374 9391 Wasatch 4969
Chapita Wells 5554
Buck Canyon 6193
Mesaverde 7333
Middle Price River 8118
Lower Price River 8901
Sego 9423

32. Additional remarks (include pluggingprocedun:):

See Attached Sheet.

33. Indicate which items have beenattached byplacing a check intheappropriate boxes:

O Electrical/Mechanical Logs(1 fullset reg'd.) O GeologicReport IXI'Report ODirectional Survey

O SundryNotice forplugging and cement verification O CoreAnalysis OOther:

34 I hereby certify thatthe foregoing and attached information is complete and correct asdeterminedfrom all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name(please print Carrie MacDonal Title Operations Clerk

Signature Date 08/03/2007

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001 and Title43 U.S.C Section1212, make it a crime forany person knowinglyand willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

(Continuedon page3) (Form 3160-4,page



East Chapita 5-5- ADDITIONAL REMARKS (CONTINUED):

26. PERFORATION RECORD

8127-8372 3/spf
7844-8050 3/spf
7601-7761 3/spf
7374-7558 3/spf

27. ACID, FRACTURE TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
8127-8372 55,398 GALS GELLED WATER & 158,000# 20/40 SAND
7844-8050 47,501 GALS GELLED WATER & 132,500#20/40 SAND
7601-7761 55,354 GALS GELLED WATER & 157,500# 20/40 SAND
7374-7558 56,460 GALSGELLED WATER & 137,720# 20/40 SAND

Perforated the Lower Price River from 9221-9222', 9239-9240', 9275-9276',

9282-9283', 9291-9292', 9296-9297', 9335-9336', 9351-9352', 9388-9391' w/ 3

spf.

Perforated the Lower Price River from 8867-8868', 8886-8887', 8898-8899',

8918-8919', 8941-8942', 8964-8965', 8986-8987', 9031-9032', 9057-9058', 9083-

9084', 9096-9097', 9143-9144', 9211-9213' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 8661-8662', 8669-8670', 8674-8675',

8698-8699', 8705-8706', 8737-8738', 8765-8766', 8774-8775', 8801-8804', 8815-

8816' w/ 3 spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 8420-8421', 8436-8437', 8469-8470',

8476-8477', 8507-8508', 8514-8515', 8525-8526', 8546-8547', 8569-8570', 8577-

8578', 8590-8591', 8600-8602' w/ 2



Perforated the Middle Price River from 8127-8128', 8140-8141', 8181-8182',

8197-8198', 8217-8218', 8239-8240', 8274-8275', 8283-8284', 8322-8323', 8335-

8336', 8354-8355', 8371-8372' w/ 3 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7844-7845', 7850-7851', 7881-7882',

7906-7907', 7919-7920', 7950-7951', 7966-7967', 8003-8006', 8044-8045', 8049-

8050' wl 3 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7601-7602', 7611-7612', 7634-7635',

7658-7659', 7664-7665', 7686-7687', 7721-7723', 7732-7733', 7750-7751', 7756-

7757', 7760-7761' w/ 3 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7374-7375', 7399-7400', 7414-7415',

7449-7451', 7476-7477', 7523-7524', 7538-7540', 7549-7550', 7556-7558' w/ 3



API Well No: 43047364900000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-01304 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 BADLANDS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 E CHAPITA 5-5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047364900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0601 FNL 0631 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 05 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

6/10/2009

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The reserve pit on the referenced location was closed on 6/10/2009 as per
the APD procedure.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Mary Maestas

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 7/9/2009

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-9111  Ext 

Pit closure

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 824-5526

July 09, 2009

July 09, 2009

iPI Well No: 43047364900000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EO13EO4DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. BADLANDS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well E CHAPITA 5-5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources,Inc. 43047364900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0601 FNL 0631 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; NENE Section: 05 Township: 09.05 Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

6/10/2009 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Pit closure

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The reserve pit on the referenced location was closed on 6/10/2009 as per
the APD procedure. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR REgogNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mary Maestas 303 824-5526 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/9/2009

RECEIVED July 09,



API Well No: 43047364900000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-01304 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 BADLANDS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 E CHAPITA 5-5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047364900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0601 FNL 0631 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 05 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

12/1/2009

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests authorization to Recomplete the
referenced well as per the attached procedure. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Mickenzie Gates

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 12/1/2009

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-9111  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-9145

December 01, 2009

December 02, 2009

iPI Well No: 43047364900000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING E0 3EO4DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. BADLANDS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well E CHAPITA 5-5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources,Inc. 43047364900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1060 East Highway 40 , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-9111 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0601 FNL 0631 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 05 Township: 09.05 Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

12/1/2009
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests authorization to Recomplete the
referenced well as per the attached procedure. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: De embef 2009

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 12/1/2009

RECEIVED December 01,



December 01, 2009

RECOMPLETION PROGRAM
ECW 5-05

ECW 5-05 November 18, 2009
601' FNL & 631' FEL (NE/NE) (Lot 1) EOG BPO WI: 100.00%
Section 5, T9S, R23E EOG BPO NRI: 84.75%
Uintah County, Utah API# 43-047-36490
Lat 40.070378 Long -109.343092 (NAD 27) AFE# 303269

WELL DATA:

ELEVATION: 4,942' GL KB: 4,962' (20' KB)

TOTAL DEPTH: 9,535' KB PBTD: 9,494' KB (Top of FC)

CASING: 9-5/8", 36#, J-55 sTc set @ 2,537'. cemented w/ 200 sx
Class G cement. Bump plug, Float held. No Returns. Top
out w/ 475 sxs amt in 3 stages. Cmt to surface.

4-1/2", 11.6#, N-80 LTC set @ 9,535'. Cemented w/ 370 sx
HiLift 35/65 Pozmix "G" & 1,550 sx 50/50 Pozmix "G".
Bumped plug, float held. Full Returns. Marker joints @
7,341-363' (22') and 4,427-449' (22'). Coment Top est. @
2,337' in PERC.

Twin - N/A

EXISTING PERFS SPF/Phasing INTERVAL FRAC #
9221-9222', 9239-9240', 9275-9276',

Lower Price9282-9283', 9291-9292', 9296-9297', 3/120° 1
River9335-9336', 9351-9352', 9388-9391'

8867-8868', 8886-8887', 8898-8899',
8918-8919', 8941-8942', 8964-8965',

Lower Price8986-8987', 9031-9032', 9057-9058', 2/180° 2
River9083-9084', 9096-9097', 9143-9144',

9211-9213'
8661-8662', 8669-8670', 8674-8675',
8698-8699', 8705-8706', 8737-8738', o Middle Price3/120 38765-8766', 8774-8775', 8801-8804', River
8815-8816'
8420-8421', 8436-8437', 8469-8470',
8476-8477', 8507-8508', 8514-8515', o Middle Price

2/180 48525-8526', 8546-8547', 8569-8570', River
8577-8578', 8590-8591', 8600-8602'
8127-8128', 8140-8141', 8181-8182',
8197-8198', 8217-8218', 8239-8240', o Middle Price3/120 58274-8275', 8283-8284', 8322-8323', River
8335-8336', 8354-8355', 8371-8372'
7844-7845', 7850-7851', 7881-7882',
7906-7907', 7919-7920', 7950-7951', 3/120° Upper Price
7966-7967', 8003-8006', 8044-8045', River
8049-8050'
7601-7602', 7611-7612', 7634-7635',
7658-7659', 7664-7665', 7686-7687', 3/120° Upper Price
7721-7723', 7732-7733', 7750-7751', River
7756-7757', 7760-7761'
7374-7375', 7399-7400', 7414-7415',

Upper Price7449-7451', 7476-7477', 7523-7524', 3/120° 8
River7538-7540', 7549-7550', 7556-7558'

RECEIVED December 01,



December 01, 2009

RECOMPLETION PROGRAM
ECW 5-05

PROPOSED PERFS SPF/Phasing INTERVAL FRAC #
7078-7079', 7104-7105', 7150-7152',
7170-7171' 7175-7176' 7182-7183', o' ' 2/180 North Horn 97221-7222', 7228-7229', 7233-7234',
7241-7242', 7272-7273'
6695-6696', 6704-6705', 6712-6713',
6727-6728', 6739-6740', 6776-6777',
6812-6813', 6888-6889', 6914-6915', 2/180° North Horn/Ba 10
6952-6953', 6966-6967', 6990-6991',
7006-7007'
6195-6196', 6204-6205', 6243-6244',
6256-6257', 6302-6303', 6336-6337',
6348-6349', 6381-6382', 6395-6396', 2/180° Ba 11
6436-6437', 6469-6470', 6493-6494',
6531-6532', 6558-6559'
5642-5644', 5655-5656', 5660-5661',
5675-5676', 5682-5683', 5689-5690', 2/180° Ca 12
5698-5700', 5707-5709', 5715-5716'

5437-5445' 2/180° Pp 13

PROCEDURE:

1. MIRUSU. Kill well w/treated water. ND tree. NU 10M psig BOPE. PU
3-7/8" bit, 4-1/2" casing scraper, & 2-3/8" 4.7# N-80 EUE tubing. RIH
to PBTD. POH.

2. RUWL. Set 10K CFP @ 6,860'. RDWL.

3. Test casing & BOPE to 6,500 psig. RUWL. Perforate North Horn
intervals from 6,595'-6,846' as shown using a 3-1/8" HSC ported casing
gun. RDWL.

4. RU Service Company. Frac down casing per attached procedure. RO
Service Company.

5. RUWL. Set Weatherford 10K composite frac plug @ 7,045'±. Perforate
Ba/North Horn intervals from 6,695'-7,007' as shown. RDWL.

6. RU Service Company. Frac down casing per attached procedure. RD
Service Company.

7. RUWL. Set Weatherford 10K composite frac plug @ 6,605'±. Perforate
Ba intervals from 6,195'-6,559' as shown. RDWL.

8. RU Service Company. Frac down casing per attached procedure. RD
Service Company.

9. RUWL. Set Weatherford 10K composite frac plug @ 5,740'±. Perforate
Ca intervals from 5,642'-5,716' as shown. RDWL.

10. RU Service Company. Frac down casing per attached procedure. RD
Service Company.

11. RUWL. Set Weatherford 10K composite frac plug @ 5,490'±. Perforate
Pp intervals from 5,437'-5,445' as shown. RDWL.

12. RU Service Company. Frac down casing per attached procedure. RD
Service Company. Flow back immediately (if required, set a composite
bridge plug at 5,350'±). Following flowback, RIH w/3-7/8" bit & pump
off sub. Drill out composite frac plugs. Clean out to PBTD. Land
tubing @ 8,100'. ND BOPE. NU 10M psig tree. Drop ball. Pump off
bit & sub. Swab/flow test.

RECEIVED December 01,



December 01, 2009

RECOMPLETION PROGRAM
ECW 5-05

13. RDMOSU. Place well on production.

PREPARED BY:
SHAY HOLTE, COMPLETIONS ENGINEER

APPROVED BY:
PAUL PENDLETON, OPERATIONS MANAGER

RECEIVED December 01,



API Well No: 43047364900000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-01304 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 BADLANDS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 E CHAPITA 5-5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047364900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0601 FNL 0631 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 05 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

2/3/2010

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 The referenced well was recompleted as per the attached. Well was returned
to sales on 2/3/2010, commingling the Wasatch and Mesaverde formations.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Mary Maestas

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2/4/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-9111  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
303 824-5526

February 08, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047364900000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING EO13EO4DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. BADLANDS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well E CHAPITA 5-5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources,Inc. 43047364900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0601 FNL 0631 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; NENE Section: 05 Township: 09.05 Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

2/3/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was recompleted as per the attached. Well was returned
to sales on 2/3/2010, commingling the Wasatch and Mesaverde formationsAccepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RE gggggy

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mary Maestas 303 824-5526 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



Well Name: ECW 005−05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

AFE No 310024 AFE Total 202,500 DHC / CWC 0/ 202,500

Rig Contr ROYAL WELL
SERVICE

Rig Name ROYAL RIG #1 Start Date 01−06−2010 Release Date

01−06−2010 Reported By TERA CHRISTOFFERSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $903,373 Well Total $2,167,276

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374−9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA


601’ FNL & 631’ FEL (NE/NE) LOT 1


SECTION 5, T9S, R23E


UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH





LAT 40.070342, LONG 109.343772 (NAD 83)


LAT 40.070378, LONG 109.343092 (NAD 27)








TD:  9535’ WASATCH


DW/GAS


EAST CHAPITA PROSPECT


DD&A:  CHAPITA DEEP


NATURAL BUTTES FIELD





LEASE:  U−01304


ELEVATION:  4943.3’ NAT GL, 4942.4’ PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING 4942’ IS THE PREP GL), 4962’ KB (20’)





EOG WI 100%, NRI 84.75%

01−08−2010 Reported By BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $6,751 Daily Total $6,751

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $910,124 Well Total $2,174,027

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374−9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIH W/MILL & SCRAPER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 15:00 8.0 MIRUSU. FTP 400 PSIG. CP 1100 PSIG. BLEW WELL DN. KILLED WELL W/60 BBLS TFW. ND TREE & NU BOP.
RIH TO TAG @ 9347’ (7 SETS OF PERFS BELOW TAG). POH. RIH W/3−7/8" MILL & SCRAPER TO 7350’. SDFN.

01−09−2010 Reported By BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $9,592 Daily Total $9,592

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $919,716 Well Total $2,183,619

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374−9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Page 35

February 04, 2010February 04, 2010

Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

AFE No 310024 AFE Total 202,500 DHC / CWC 0/202,500

Rig Contr ROYAL WELL Rig Name ROYAL RIG #1 Start Date 01-06-2010 Release Date
SERVICE

01-06-2010 Reported By TERA CHRISTOFFERSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $903,373 Well Total $2,167,276

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

601'FNL & 631'FEL (NE/NE) LOT l

SECTION 5, T9S, R23E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

LAT 40.070342, LONG 109.343772 (NAD 83)

LAT 40.070378, LONG 109.343092 (NAD 27)

TD: 9535' WASATCH

DW/GAS

EAST CHAPITA PROSPECT

DD&A: CHAPITA DEEP

NATURAL BUTTES FIELD

LEASE: U-01304

ELEVATION: 4943.3' NAT GL, 4942.4' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING 4942' IS THE PREP GL), 4962' KB (20')

EOG WI 100%, NRI 84.75%

01-08-2010 Reported By BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $6,751 Daily Total $6,751

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $910,124 Well Total $2,174,027

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIH W/MILL & SCRAPER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 15:00 8.0 MIRUSU. FTP 400 PSIG. CP 1100 PSIG. BLEW WELL DN. KILLED WELL W/60 BBLS TFW. ND TREE & NU BOP
RIH TO TAG @9347' (7 SETS OF PERFS BELOW TAG). POH. RIH W/3-7/8" MILL & SCRAPER TO 7350'. SDFN.

01-09-2010 Reported By BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $9,592 Daily Total $9,592

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $919,716 Well Total $2,183,619

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7374-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Page 35

RECEIVED February 04,



Well Name: ECW 005−05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

Activity at Report Time: LD TBG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 17:00 10.0 SITP 200 PSIG. SICP 175 PSIG. BLEW WELL DN. KILLED W/40 BBLS TFW. RIH TO TAG @ 9335’. RU POWER
SWIVEL & FOAM UNIT. BROKE CIRCULATION. CLEANED OUT FROM 9335’ TO 9430’. KILLED TBG W/40
BBLS TFW. LD TBG TO 5400’. SDFW.

01−12−2010 Reported By BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $11,182 Daily Total $11,182

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $930,898 Well Total $2,194,801

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7078−9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRAC

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 14:00 7.0 SITP 650 PSIG. SICP 650 PSIG. BLEW WELL DN. KILLED TBG W/30 BBLS TFW. POH, LD TBG. ND BOP. NU 10K
FRAC VALVES. RU CUTTERS WL. SET 10K CBP @ 7330’. PRESSURE TESTED CBP AND CSG TO 6500 PSIG.
PERFORATE NORTH HORN FROM 7078’−7079’, 7104’−7105’, 7150’−7152’, 7170’−7171’, 7175’−7176’, 7182’−7183’,
7221’−7222’, 7228’−7229’, 7233’−7234’, 7241’−7242’, 7272’−7273’ @ 2 SPF @ 180 DEG PHASING. RDWL.
RDMOSU. PREP FOR FRAC.

01−19−2010 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $137,042 Daily Total $137,042

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,067,940 Well Total $2,331,844

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE /
WASATCH

PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437−9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO MIRUSU

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC NORTH HORN DOWN CASING W/110 GAL K−87 MICROBIOCIDE, 10670 GAL 16#
LINEAR W/13900# 20/40 SAND @ 1−1.5 PPG, 34348 GAL 16# DELTA 140 W/115600# 20/40 SAND @ 2−4 PPG,
SCALECHEK HT @ 1.5#/1000# SAND. MTP 4852 PSIG. MTR 49.9 BPM. ATP 4171 PSIG. ATR 49.3 BPM. ISIP 2549
PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE SET 6K CFP AT 7030’. PERFORATE Ba/NORTH HORN FROM 6695’−96’, 6704’−05’,
6712’−13’, 6727’−28’, 6739’−40’, 6776’−77’, 6812’−13’, 6888’−89’, 6914’−15’, 6952’−53’, 6966’−67’, 6990’−91’,
7006’−07’ @ 2 SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/110 GAL K−
87 MICROBIOCIDE, 4259 GAL 16# LINEAR W/4300# 20/40 SAND @ 1 PPG, 24321 GAL 16# DELTA 140 W/53700#
20/40 SAND @ 1.5−4 PPG, SCALECHEK HT @ 1.5#/1000# SAND. MTP 6226 PSIG. MTR 45.6 BPM. ATP 29.2 PSIG.
ATR 29.2 BPM. ISIP 2463 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 6580’. PERFORATE Ba FROM 6195’−96’, 6204’−05’, 6243’−44’, 6256’−57’, 6302’−03’,
6336’−37’, 6348’−49’, 6381’−82’, 6395’−96’, 6436’−37’, 6469’−70’, 6493’−94’, 6531’−32’, 6558’−59’ @ 2 SPF & 180
DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/110 GAL K−87 MICROBIOCIDE, 4165
GAL 16# LINEAR W/4200# 20/40 SAND @ 1 PPG, 24043 GAL 16# DELTA 140 W/53700# 20/40 SAND @ 1.5−4 PPG,
MTP 6357 PSIG. MTR 47.5 BPM. ATP 6008 PSIG. ATR 33.5 BPM. ISIP 1723 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.





RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 5740’. PERFORATE Ca FROM 5642’−44’, 5655’−56’, 5660’−61’, 5675’−76’, 5682’−83’,
5689’−90’, 5698’−700’, 5707’−09’, 5715’−16’ @ 2 SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC
DOWN CASING W/110 GAL K−87 MICROBIOCIDE, 28352 GAL 16# DELTA 140 W/102100# 20/40 SAND @ 3−4
PPG,  MTP 3954 PSIG. MTR 54.3 BPM. ATP 49.9 PSIG. ATR 49.9 BPM. ISIP 2340 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

Activity at Report Time: LD TBG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 17:00 10.0 SITP 200 PSIG. SICP 175 PSIG. BLEW WELL DN. KILLED W/40 BBLS TFW. RIH TO TAG @9335'. RU POWER
SWIVEL & FOAM UNIT. BROKE CIRCULATION. CLEANED OUT FROM 9335' TO 9430'. KILLED TBG W/40
BBLS TFW. LD TBG TO 5400'. SDFW.

01-12-2010 Reported By BAUSCH

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $11,182 Daily Total $11,182

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $930,898 Well Total $2,194,801

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 7078-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRAC

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 14:00 7.0 SITP 650 PSIG. SICP 650 PSIG. BLEW WELL DN. KILLED TBG W/30 BBLS TFW. POH, LD TBG. ND BOP. NU 10K
FRAC VALVES. RU CUTTERS WL. SET 10K CBP @7330'. PRESSURE TESTED CBP AND CSG TO 6500 PSIG.
PERFORATE NORTH HORN FROM 7078'-7079', 7104'-7105', 7150'-7152', 7170'-7171', 7175'-7176', 7182'-7183',
722l'-7222', 7228'-7229', 7233'-7234', 724l'-7242', 7272'-7273'@ 2 SPF @180 DEG PHASING. RDWL.
RDMOSU. PREP FOR FRAC.

01-19-2010 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $137,042 Daily Total $137,042

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,067,940 Well Total $2,331,844

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE / PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0
WASATCH

Activity at Report Time: PREP TO MIRUSU

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC NORTH HORN DOWN CASING W/110 GAL K-87 MICROBIOCIDE, 10670 GAL 16#
LINEAR W/13900# 20/40 SAND @1-1.5 PPG, 34348 GAL 16# DELTA 140 W/l l5600# 20/40 SAND @2-4 PPG,
SCALECHEK HT @1.5#/1000# SAND. MTP 4852 PSIG. MTR 49.9 BPM. ATP 4171 PSIG. ATR 49.3 BPM. ISIP 2549
PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.

MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE SET 6K CFP AT 7030'. PERFORATE Ba/NORTH HORN FROM 6695'-96', 6704'-05',
6712'-13', 6727'-28', 6739'-40', 6776'-77', 6812'-13', 6888'-89', 6914'-15', 6952'-53', 6966'-67', 6990'-91',
7006'-07' @2 SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/110 GAL K-

87 MICROBIOCIDE, 4259 GAL 16# LINEAR W/4300# 20/40 SAND @ l PPG, 24321 GAL 16# DELTA 140 W/53700#
20/40 SAND @1.5-4 PPG, SCALECHEK HT @ l.5#/1000# SAND. MTP 6226 PSIG. MTR 45.6 BPM. ATP 29.2 PSIG.
ATR 29.2 BPM. ISIP 2463 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.

RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 6580'. PERFORATE Ba FROM 6195'-96', 6204'-05', 6243'-44', 6256'-57', 6302'-03',
6336'-37', 6348'-49', 6381'-82', 6395'-96', 6436'-37', 6469'-70', 6493'-94', 6531'-32', 6558'-59'@ 2 SPF & 180
DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/110 GAL K-87 MICROBIOCIDE, 4165
GAL 16# LINEAR W/4200# 20/40 SAND @ l PPG, 24043 GAL 16# DELTA 140 W/53700# 20/40 SAND @1.5-4 PPG,
MTP 6357 PSIG. MTR 47.5 BPM. ATP 6008 PSIG. ATR 33.5 BPM. ISIP 1723 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.

RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 5740'. PERFORATE Ca FROM 5642'-44', 5655'-56', 5660'-61', 5675'-76', 5682'-83',
5689'-90', 5698'-700', 5707'-09', 5715'-16' @2 SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU HALLIBURTON, FRAC
DOWN CASING W/110 GAL K-87 MICROBIOCIDE, 28352 GAL 16# DELTA 140 W/102100# 20/40 SAND @3-4

PPG, MTP 3954 PSIG. MTR 54.3 BPM. ATP 49.9 PSIG. ATR 49.9 BPM. ISIP 2340 PSIG. RD HALLIBURTON.
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Well Name: ECW 005−05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 5480’. PERFORATE Pp FROM 5437’−45’ @ 2 SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU
HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/110 GAL K−87 MICROBIOCIDE, 12000 GAL 16# DELTA 140 W/43900#
20/40 SAND @ 4 PPG,  MTP 6027 PSIG. MTR 53.8 BPM. ATP 4225 PSIG. ATR 46 BPM. ISIP 2129 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.





RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 5363’. RD CUTTERS WIRELINE. SDFN.

01−21−2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $19,871 Daily Total $19,871

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,087,811 Well Total $2,351,715

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE /
WASATCH

PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437−9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: CLEAN OUT AFTER FRAC

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUSU. ND FRAC TREE. NU BOP.  RIH W/JUNK MILL &  BIT SUB TO 5363’. RU TO DRILL OUT PLUGS.  SDFN.

01−22−2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $15,547 Daily Total $15,547

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,103,359 Well Total $2,367,262

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE /
WASATCH

PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437−9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POH

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 0 PSIG. RU WEATHERFORD FOAM UNIT. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @ 5363’, 5480’, 5740’,
6580’, 7030’ & CBP @ 7330’. RIH TO TAG @ 9273’. CLEANED OUT TO 9457’. POH TO 5376’. SDFN.

01−23−2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $15,053 Daily Total $15,053

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,118,412 Well Total $2,382,315

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE /
WASATCH

PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437−9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 200 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. POH. RIH W/PRODUCTION STRING. LANDED TBG @ 8098’
KB. ND BOP & NU TREE. RU FOAM UNIT & BLEW WELL AROUND. RDMOSU.





FLOWED 6 HRS. 48/64" CHOKE. FTP 0 PSIG. CP 800 PSIG. 0 BFPH. RECOVERED 50 BLW. 3950 BLWTR. WELL
DIED @ 5:00 PM. BLEW CSG DN. SI 5 HRS. SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 800 PSIG.  





TUBING DETAIL					LENGTH





PUMP OFF BIT SUB				0.40’


1 JT 2−3/8" 4.7# N−80 TBG 				33.10’


XN NIPPLE					1.30’


246 JTS 2−3/8" 4.7# N−80 TBG				8043.50’
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

RUWL. SET 6K CFP AT 5480'. PERFORATE Pp FROM 5437'-45' @2 SPF & 180 DEGREE PHASING. RDWL. RU
HALLIBURTON, FRAC DOWN CASING W/110 GAL K-87 MICROBIOCIDE, 12000 GAL 16# DELTA 140 W/43900#
20/40 SAND @4 PPG, MTP 6027 PSIG. MTR 53.8 BPM. ATP 4225 PSIG. ATR 46 BPM. ISIP 2129 PSIG. RD
HALLIBURTON.

RUWL. SET 6K CBP AT 5363'. RD CUTTERS WIRELINE. SDFN.

01-21-2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $19,871 Daily Total $19,871

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,087,811 Well Total $2,351,715

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE / PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0
WASATCH

Activity at Report Time: CLEAN OUT AFTER FRAC

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUSU. ND FRAC TREE. NU BOP. RIH W/JUNK MILL & BIT SUB TO 5363'. RU TO DRILL OUT PLUGS. SDFN.

01-22-2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $15,547 Daily Total $15,547

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,103,359 Well Total $2,367,262

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE / PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0
WASATCH

Activity at Report Time: POH

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 0 PSIG. RU WEATHERFORD FOAM UNIT. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @5363', 5480', 5740',
6580', 7030' & CBP @7330'. RIH TO TAG @9273'. CLEANED OUT TO 9457'. POH TO 5376'. SDFN.

01-23-2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $15,053 Daily Total $15,053

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,118,412 Well Total $2,382,315

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE / PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0
WASATCH

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 200 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. POH. RIH W/PRODUCTION STRING. LANDED TBG @8098'
KB. ND BOP & NU TREE. RU FOAM UNIT & BLEW WELL AROUND. RDMOSU.

FLOWED 6 HRS. 48/64" CHOKE. FTP 0 PSIG. CP 800 PSIG. 0 BFPH. RECOVERED 50 BLW. 3950 BLWTR. WELL
DIED @5:00 PM. BLEW CSG DN. SI 5 HRS. SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 800 PSIG.

TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

PUMP OFF BIT SUB 0.40'

l JT 2-3/8" 4.7# N-80 TBG 33.10'

XN NIPPLE 1.30'

246 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7#N-80 TBG 8043.50'
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Well Name: ECW 005−05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

BELOW KB					20.00’


LANDED @					8098.30’ KB

01−24−2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $7,103 Daily Total $7,103

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,125,515 Well Total $2,389,418

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE /
WASATCH

PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437−9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI TO BUILD PRESSURE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 8 HRS. 48/64" CHOKE. FTP 0 PSIG. CP 800 PSIG. 0 BFPH. RECOVERED 0 BLW. 3950 BLWTR. SI TO
BUILD PRESSURE.

01−28−2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $12,690 Daily Total $12,690

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,138,205 Well Total $2,402,108

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE /
WASATCH

PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437−9391 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MIRU SWAB UNIT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 1300 PSIG. MIRUSU. BLEW WELL DOWN. ND TREE & NU BOP. POH.  LD TBG TO 5549’ KB.
ND BOP & NU TREE. RDMOSU.





TUBING DETAIL					LENGTH





PUMP OFF BIT SUB				.40’


1 JT 2−3/8" 4.7# N−80 TBG 				32.72’


XN NIPPLE					1.30’


168 JTS 2−3/8" 4.7# N−80 TBG				5494.51’


BELOW KB					20.00’


LANDED @					5548.93’ KB
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Well Name: ECW 005-05 Field: CHAPITA DEEP Property: 056062

BELOW KB 20.00'

LANDED @ 8098.30' KB

01-24-2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $7,103 Daily Total $7,103

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,125,515 Well Total $2,389,418

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE / PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0
WASATCH

Activity at Report Time: SI TO BUILD PRESSURE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 8 HRS. 48/64" CHOKE. FTP 0 PSIG. CP 800 PSIG. 0 BFPH. RECOVERED 0 BLW. 3950 BLWTR. SI TO
BUILD PRESSURE.

01-28-2010 Reported By HISLOP

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $12,690 Daily Total $12,690

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,263,903 Completion $1,138,205 Well Total $2,402,108

MD 9,535 TVD 9,535 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE / PBTD : 9494.0 Perf : 5437-9391 PKR Depth : 0.0
WASATCH

Activity at Report Time: MIRU SWAB UNIT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 1300 PSIG. MIRUSU. BLEW WELL DOWN. ND TREE & NU BOP. POH. LD TBG TO 5549'KB.
ND BOP & NU TREE. RDMOSU.

TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

PUMP OFF BIT SUB .40'

l JT 2-3/8" 4.7# N-80 TBG 32.72'

XN NIPPLE l.30'

168 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7#N-80 TBG 5494.51'

BELOW KB 20.00'

LANDED @ 5548.93' KB

Page 38

RECEIVED February 04,



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-01304 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 BADLANDS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 E CHAPITA 5-5 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047364900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0601 FNL 0631 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 05 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

7/1/2011

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: Install H2S tower

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization to install an H2S scavenging tower
on the above referenced well pad. The proposed tower will be installed on
existing disturbance; no new disturbance will be required. Attached is a

diagram showing general placement of the facilities. 

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mary Maestas 303 824-5526

TITLE
 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5/27/2011

06/20/2011

May. 27, 2011

Sundry Number: 15360 API Well Number: 43047364900000Sundry Number: aÊÀpyg ggr: 43047364900000

Action is Necessary

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING E0 3EO4DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. BADLANDS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well E CHAPITA 5-5

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047364900000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURAL BUTTES

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0601 FNL 0631 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NENE Section: 05 Township: 09.05 Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

7/1/2011
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Install H2S tower

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization to install an H2S scavenging tower
on the above referenced well pad. The proposed tower will be installed on

existing disturbance; no new disturbance will be required. Attached is a Accepted by the
diagram showing general placement of the facilities. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: 06/20/2 1

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mary Maestas 303 824-5526 Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/27/2011

RECEIVED May. 27,
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Sundry Number: 15360 API Well Number: 43047364900000
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RECEIVED May. 27,
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