
FORM APPROVED

Form 3160-3 OMBNO. 1040-0138

"2) UNITED STATES SUBMITINTRIPLICATE. Expires:February28,1995

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-0558

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN NIA

TYPE OF WORK 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME

DRILL Œ DEEPENO RED WASH UNIT

TYPE OF WELL 8. FARMOR LEASE NAME,WELL NO.

O O O SINGLE MULTIPLE
O

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE RW 34-34 AMU

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Contact: Jan Nelson 9. API WELL NO.

OEP UINTA BASIN, INC. E-Mall: jan.nelsongquestar.com '7 g (, 3 Sj
3. ADDRESS Telphone number 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

11002 E. 17500 S. Vernal, Ut 84078 Phone 435-781-4331 Fax 435-781-4323 REEPWRSH l.Akt 7LLE

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*) 11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEY OR AREA

At Surface (o 9/O X 858' FSL 1944' FEL, SWSE, SECTION 34, T78, R22E

At proposed production zone Ÿgg is Ÿ Ô·/ // Ñ/b / - 9, Ÿ$Ò SEC.34, T7S, R22E, Mer SLB

14. DISTANCEINMILESFROM NEARESTTOWNOR POSTOFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARISE 13. STATE

32 MILES + I - FROM VERNAL, UT UIntah UT

15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION TO NEAREST 16.NO.0F ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRESASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(also to nearest drig,unit line If any) 2560 40

858'+/-

18.DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BLMIBIA Bond No. on file

completed, applied for, on this lease, R 9900, ESBOOOO24

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.) 22. DATE WORK WILL START 23. Estimated duration

5207.6' GR ASAP 10 days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore 011and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certifiedby a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an exisiting bond on file (see

2. A DrillingPlan Item20 above)
3. A surface Use Plan (if location is on National Forest System Lands• 5. Operator certification.

the SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may b CEWED
authorized officer. MMO/ 2005

SIGNED Name (printedityped) Jan Nelson

AÛ
r ,

20osNWG

TITLE Regulatory Affairs Analyst

(This space for Federal or State oNice use)

PERMITNO. APPROVAL DATE

Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds any legal or equitable tHis to those rights In the subject lease which would entHis the applicant to conduct operaBons thereon

CONDITIONS F APPROVAL, IF ANY:

BRADLEYG. HILL
APPROVED BY TITLE ENVIRONMENTALSCIENTISTIII DATE

*See Instructions On Reverse Side

18 U.S.C Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfullyto make to any depaitment or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any maler within its jurisdiction

FederalApproval of this
Action is Necessary

CONROENTI



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.T7S R22E S.L.B.&M ' Well location, RW #34-34 AMU, located as
shown in the SW 1/4 SE 1/4 of Section 34,S89°55'W

- 5253.60' (G.L.O.) T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah
BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK 20EAM LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION
35, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE,
QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTEQUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY.

d SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 4697 FEET.
BASIS OF BEARINGS

BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

1941 Brass Cap
O.J' H/ph, Mound No or stmes

°i

34 184.80'(G.LO.

I
~o oo

^o

oo o - o

SCALE

CERTIFI **"Ill·¯¯¯¯

LANDTHISIS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE AT•WAS FROM
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUALSU E BY ME MYRW /J4--J4 AMU 1944' SUPERVISIONANDTHAT THE •ARE TRUE TO THEElev. Ungraded Ground = 5210' BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEA

co
00 EGISEEREDLAND 501938 Bross Cap 1938 Brass CoP 1936 Brass Cap TION.NOT1.2' High, Mound 1.f H/gh, Mound 0.4' High, Mound S (T7S ,, st..,, or st...

,, se.., e
TBS ss9°56'25"w

- 2637.95' (Me s.) 589°55'47"W
- 26Jo59' (Me s)

UINTAH BGINEERING & IAND SURVEYING
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAI. UTAH 84078

LEGEND CONRDENTIo sa, (426) 282-201,

LATITUDE= 40°09'47.18" (40.163106) SCALE DATESURVEYED: DATEDRAWN:
1 = 1000 12-13-04 01-03-05= 90 SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109°25°25.00" (109.423611) PARTY REFERENCES

= PROPOSED WELL HEAD
(NAD 27) D.A. T.C. D.R.B- G.L.O. PLATLATITUDE= 40°09'47.31" (40.163142) WEATHER FILEA = SECTION CORNERSLOCATED· LONGITUDE= 109°25'22.53" (109.422925) COLD QUESTAREXPLR. &



Additional Operator Remarks

QEP, Uinta Basin Inc. proposes to drill a well to 9900' to test the MesaVerde. If productive, casing
willbe run and the well completed. Ifdry, the wellwillbe plugged and abandoned as per BLM and
State of Utah requirements

Please see QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated
fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 and 24 East.

See attached Onshore No. 1

Please be advised that QEP, Uinta Basin Inc, agrees to be responsible under the terms and
conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No.ESBOOOO24. The principal is QEP, Uinta Basin
Inc. via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR 3104.2.



Qep Uinta Basin, Inc.
RW 34-34 AMU

ONSHORE OIL& GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

AIIlease and/or unitoperations willbe conducted in such a manner thatfull compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditionswillbe furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth
Uinta Surface
Green River 2920'
Wasatch 6590'
Mesa Verde 9250'
TD 9900'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil, Gas, Water and Other Mineral Bearinq Zones

The estimated depths at whichthe topand bottom of the anticipated water, oil,gas or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Oil/Gas Mese Verde 9900'

AIIfresh water and prospectively valuable mineralsencountered during drilling,willbe
recorded by depth and adequately protected. AIIoiland gas shows willbe tested to
determine commercialpotential.

AIIwater shows and water-bearing sands willbe reported to the BLMin Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. Ifno flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLMalong with any water analyses conducted.

3. Anticipated Bottom Hole Pressures

Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 4293.0 psi.



RW 34-34 AMU
858' FSL 1944' FEL

SWSE, SECTION 34, T7S, R22E,
UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH

LEASE # UTU-0558

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI - POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

An onsite inspection was conducted for the RW 34-34 AMU on February 23, 2005. Weather conditions
were coldand muddyat the timeof the onsite. In attendance at the inspection were the following individuals:

Paul Buhler Bureau of Land Management
Todd McGrath Bureau of Land Management
Jan Nelson QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Amy Garcia QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.

1 Existina Roads:

The proposed well site is approximately32 milesfrom Vemal, Utah.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads withina 2 - mile radius.

There will be no improvements made to existingaccess roads.

2. Planned Access Reads:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin Inc. Standard OperatingPractices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, WonsitsValley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Refer toTopo Map B for the location of theproposed access road.

3. Location of Existing Welië Within a 1 - MIIe Radius:

Please refer toTopo Map C.

4. Location efExisting & Preposed Faëllities:

Please see QEP UintaBasin inc. Standard OperatingPractices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, WonsitsValley, GypsumHills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Refer toTopo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.

5. Location and Tvoo of Water Sunoiv:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin Inc. Standard OperatingPractices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to24 East.



6. Source of Conëtrpç†lon Materiale:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin Inc. Standard OperatingPractices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to24 East.

7. Methods efHandling Waste Materials:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin Inc. Standard OperatingPractices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, WonsitsValley, Gypsum Hills,WhiteRiver, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to24 East.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

Please see QEP UintaBasin Inc. Standard OperatingPractices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

9. WellSite Layept: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagramdescribes drillpad cross-sections, cuts and fills
and locations of themudtanks, reserve pit, flarepit, pipe racks, trailerparking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s),and surface materialstockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access
roads.

A pit liner is required felt if rock encountered.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please see QEP Uinta Basin Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Mesa Verde Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fieldsin Townships07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to24 East.

Seed mix # 5

11. Surface Ownership:

The wellpad and access road are located on lands ownedby:

Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4400

12. Other Information

A Class Ill archaeologicalsurveywas conducted by MontgomeryArchaeology
Consultants. A copy of thisreport was submi#ed directly totheappropriateagencies by
MontgomeryArchaeologyConsultants. Culturalresource clearance was recommended
for this location.

There is a Ferruginous Hawk Stipulationfrom March ist to July 15th. No constructionor drillingwill
commence during thisperiod unless otherwisedetermined by a wildlifebiologist thatthe site is inactive.

Two Erosion Control Structures.
( 1 ) Near stake # 3.
( 2 ) After backfilling reserve pit construct erosion controlstructure.

Proposed access route and the well pad willrequire paleontological monitoring.



Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

Jan Nelson
Red Wash Rep.

QEP Uinta Basin Inc.
11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4331

Certification:

AIIlease and/or unitoperations willbe conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made withall applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved

plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. willbe fully responsible for the actions of theirsubcontractors.

A complete copy ofthe approved Application for Permit to Drillwillbe furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all

construction and drillingoperations.

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently

exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated withthe operations proposed herein willbe

performed by QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. its' contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this plan and the termsand conditions under which it is approved. This statement is

subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

01-Mar-05
/ ÀanNelson Date

V Red Wash Representative



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
RW 34-34 AMU

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 34, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

I

I-·.i. I I.I i
¯

---

I

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCAl lON STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHEASTERLY

I

I-

I

PHOTO: VlEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: EASTERLY

a
Din[uh Etagiteenng i Land Surveymg ( 4 PHOTO
li i South liill East Vemat, 1.itati84pg iumi u.e a us

,,a;.Í,4 435-^8'l-lûl7 vehli geLiine.con1 AKENBEDA DRAWNBY:l.K, REVISED•
I



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROW FIGURE #i
LOCATIONLAYOUTFOR

RW #34-34 AMU
SECTION34, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

858' FSL 1944' FEL
J' C-1.8' CONSTRUCT F-4, f '

B. 209.4 IVERSI E 2OJ.S'

SCALE: 1" = 50' .

Sta. .3+50 Approx
DATE: 01-03-05 Toe of
Drawn By D.R.B. Exisurig pe

Drainage

N01E.

Flore Pit is to be located
a min. of 100' from the Approx. N
Well Head. Top of N

Cut Slope tity att
PIPE TUBS .

----

I I I j
I

PIPE RACKS
LARE P/T

C-2.7' I I I
a. sto.x - - C-2.8'

E/. 211. 8 E/. 210. 4'

15o' Sta. 1+¾

rm

- TOILET -2

4 '

HT P NT

BOILER

P HOUSE
CO OR R

B OSTER

---- Existing .S
sto. oest

TR SH
Total Pit Capacity
W/2' of fresboard
- 10,560 Bb/s. ±
Total P/t Volume
- 2,930 Cu. Yds. PROPANE

B A STORAGE CONSTRUCT
220.9' C-5.8' DivERSION

-25. J' ry.2724 L48 ¿DITCH Sta. 0+00 -

(btm. pit) ..-2..

4 C-0.7' install
C-1.9' s. 2os.T IS" CMP C-0.8'
B. 209.5' Proopdosed Access E/. 208.4'

Elev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Stake = 5210.4' UINTAH ENGINEERING Jc I,AND SURVEYING
F/N/SHED GRADE ELEV AT LOC. STAKE = 520Z6 ,, s.. 244 ,,,, . v,,.... ut., ,,oy, . (was; va,_,,,,



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PRO E, #2
. TYPICALCROSS SECTIONS FOR -S&

ssecton
RW #34-34 AMU

'¯

,, ,
SECTION 34, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

1 = 50 858' FSL 1944' FEL
ST

DATE: 01-03-05
Drawn By D.R.B.

48' 150'

Finished Grade

SM. J+50

10' 70' 48' 150'

Location Stoke

SM. 1+75

0 70 48' 150'

CUTF/LL

CUT
S M. 0+51

Pre cons truction
Grade 48' 150

------ CUT ...-

CUT ...-

rl--TU¶àllméTIT=
NOTE:

ITopsoil should not be
Stripped Below Finished SM. 0+00 .

Grade on Substructure Area. E/LL QUAN7/TY /NCLUDES
5% EOR COMPACT/0N

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = 4,800 Cu. Yds.

CUT Topsoil & Pit Backfill = J,190 Cu. Yds.
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,720 Cu. Yds· (1/2 Pit Vol.)
Remaining Location = 6,920 Cu. Yds. EXCESS UNBALANCE = 1,610 Cu. Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 8,640 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)

FILL = J,840 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENCINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. ß00 Fast * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (436) 789-1017

[D
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RED
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7.2 Mt. */
-

SEE TOPO "B"
.

1-••- -I
.

T7S -

TSS
1 6 FIELD

PROPOSED LOCATION:
RW #34-34 AMU

s Awv s"A"'
' genos

R R
21 22
E E

LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
PROPOSED LOCATION

N RW #34-34 AMU
SECTION 34, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

858' FSL 1944' FEL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 1 10 4
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P ONT DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1:100,000DRAWNBY:L.K. REVISED:00-0000

[1]



\ • PtPELINE

8
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2 BEN

- PROPOSED LOCATION:
RW #3 4 AMU

T7S

0510A
IHo

WHITE

R
OIL AND I LD

E
rJ

LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
EXIST[NG ROAD N RW #34-34 AMU

------------ PROPOSEDACCESNROAD SECTION34 T7S R22E S.L.B.&M.-- --- - - -- - E\lsfl\f.2 [RA( K VI Illth1 PhRAI)F 9 9 9

E
858' FSL 1944' FEL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surve TOPOGR A PH i cl 2 1 0485 South 200 East Vernal. Utah 84078 Ï ti Ÿ DATIl DAY YEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAN (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1"=1000' DRAWNBY:LICREVISED:OMO-00

Ul



218

PROP OUCAT

T7S
TSS

4

WHITE

R
OIL AN A F D

LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
þ' DISPOSAL WELLS WATER WELLS N RW #34-34 AMU

PRODUCING WELLS ABANDONED WELLs SECTION 34, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
SHUT IN WELLS -@- TEMPORARILY ABANDONED 858' FSL 1944' FEL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 12 1 04
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 M A P (ONTH DM YEAR(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE:I" = 2000' DRAWNBY:LK. REVISED:00-00-00



ry Drill
Hole

5400
i e $383

5400 '

PROPOSED LOCATION:
RW #34-34 AMU

T7S
os TSS

[PROPOSED PIPELINE / 5252
[FOR THE #6W-3-8-22 /

O GB
#6W 3422

H 6'° R
22

- 5226

APPROXIMATE TOTAL PIPELINE DISTANCE = 724'+/-

LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD N RW #34-34 AMU

------- ExisTING rirsi.tNE SECTlON 34. T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
----------- PROPONED PIPI I.INE

858' FSL 1944' FEL

M Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I Cl 2 1 04
85 Sourh 200 East Vernal. Utah 84078 M A Ÿ MONTH DAY YEAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAK (438) 189-1813
SCALE:1"= 1000' DRAWNBY:LK. REVISED:00-108



NORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 03/07/2005 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-36351

WELL NAME: RW 34-34 AMU

OPERATOR: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. ( N2460 )

CONTACT: JAN NELSON PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4331

PROPOSED LOCATION:

SWSE 34 070S 220E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SURFACE: 0858 FSL 1944 FEL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 0858 FSL 1944 FEL

UINTAH Engineering

UNDESIGNATED ( 2 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-0558

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal
LATITUDE: 40.16316

PROPOSED FORMATION: MVRD

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.4229

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

J' Plat R649-2-3.

V' Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit RED WASH

(No. ESBOOOO24 )
Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

AÁ Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

y/' Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

[No. 43-8496 )
L/' Drilling Unit

AJ RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No: 27-0']

(Date: ) Eff Date: jf.
lA Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting: ( is.0 m iarkÎ n a A in

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: IQ y

STIPULATIONS:
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OFERATOR- QEP UINTA BASIN INC (N2660)

SEC.34 &c35 T.8S R.26E

FIELD:UNDESIGNATED (002)

COUNTY: UINTAH

CAUSE:187-07/%18-2001

Nells Units.shy Fields.shp UtahOilGas and Mining
; CAS fNIECTION EXPLORATORY ABANDONED
e CAS STORAGE CAS STORAGE ACFIVE
X IDCATION ABANDONED

NEW LOCATION
NF PP OIL COMBINED

+ PLUGGED & ABANDONED NE SECONDARY INACTIVE

* PRODUC[NG GA5 FENDING PROPOSED
@ PRODUC[NG OIL PI OIL STORAGE
o SHUT.IN GAS PP GAS 11sRMINATED
• SHUT-IN OIL PF GEOTHERML 5
M TEMP. ABANDONED
= TEST WELL FP OIL

o WATER INJECTION SECONDARY

• WATER SUPPLY TERMINATED FREPARED BY:DIANA WHITNEY

# WATER DISFOSAL DATE:



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
(UT-922)

March 10, 2005

Memorandum

To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2004 Plan of Development Red Wash Unit,
Uintah County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management, the following wells are planned for calendar year
2004 within the Red Wash Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ Green River)

43-047-36348 RW 12-08FG Sec 8 TO8S R24E 1703 FNL 0738 FWL
43-047-36349 RW 44-08FG Sec 8 TO8S R24E 0461 FSL 0356 FEL
43-047-36350 RW 12-17FG Sec 17 TO8S R24E 2104 FNL 0462 FWL

(Proposed PZ Mesaverde)

43-047-36351 RW 34-34 AMU Sec 34 TO7S R22E 0858 FSL 1944 FEL
43-047-36352 RW 44-35 AMU Sec 35 TO7S R22E 0824 FSL 0199 FEL
43-047-36354 RW 14-35 AMU Sec 35 TO7S R22E 0506 FSL 0546 FWL
43-047-36357 RW 33-31 BMU Sec 31 TO7S R23E 2179 FSL 1964 FEL
43-047-36358 RW 13-31 BMU Sec 31 TO7S R23E 2329 FSL 0406 FWL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this
time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc: File - Red Wash Unit
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr . Sec . Chron
Fluid Chron



JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah
March 10, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Division of 11002 E 17500 S

Oil, Gas & Mining Vernal, UT 84078
MARY ANN WRIGHT
Acting Division Director

Re: Red Wash 34-34 AMU Well,858' FSL, 1944' FEL, SW SE, Sec. 34,
T. 7 South, R. 22 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to theprovisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions ofApproval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request.for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36351.

ely,

hn R. Baza
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

i
1594West NorthTemple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone(801)538-5340•facsimile (801)359-3940 • TTY (801)538-7458 • ww.ogm.utah.gov whereideas



Operator: QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Well Name & Number Red Wash 34-34 AMU
API Number: 43-047-36351
Lease: UTU-0558

Location: SW SE Sec. 34 T. 7 South R. 22 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to



FORM APPROVED

'7 UNITEDSTATES N CA

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOF 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-0558
By 6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR DEEPEN NIA

TYPE OF WORK 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
DRILL U DEEPENO RED WASH UNIT

TYPE OF WELL 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.

O O O SINGLE MULTIPLE
O

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER ZONE ZONE RW 34-34 AMU

2. NAME OF OPERATOR Contact: Jan Nelson 9. API WELL NO.
QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. E-Mall: Jan.nelson@questar.com

3. ADDRESS Telphone number 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
11002 E. 17500 S. Vernal, Ut 84078 Phone 435-781-4331 Fax 435-781-4323 RED WASH

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with and State requirements*) 11. SEC.,T, R, M, OR BLK & SURVEY OR AREA

At Surface 858' FSL 1944' FEL, SWSE, SECTION 34, T7S, R22E
At proposed production zone SEC.34, T78, R22E, Mer SLB

14. DISTANCE IN MILESFROM NEAREST TOWN OR POSTOFFICE* 12. COUNTY OR PARIS 13. STATE

32 MILES + I - FROM VERNAL, UT Uintah UT

15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION TO NEAREST 16.NO.OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL

PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE, FT.
(also to nearest drig,unit line If any) 2560 40

858'+/-

18.DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED location to nearest well, drilling, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BLMIBIA Bond No. on flie
completed, applied for, on this lease, R

9900'
ESBOOOO24

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, ect.) 22. DATE WORK WILL START 23. Estimated duration

5207.8' GR ASAP 10 days

24. Attachments

The following,completed in accordance with the requirments of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certifiedby a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an exisitingbond on file (see
2. A DrillingPlan Item 20 above).
3. A surface Use Plan ( if location is on National Forest System Lands, 5. Operator certification.

the SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.

SIGNED Name (printedItyped) Jan Nelson DATE March 1, 2005

TITLEV Regulatory Affairs Analyst

(This space for Federal or State office use)

PERMITNO. APPROVAL DATE

Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds any legal or equitable titleto those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicantto conduct operations thereon

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL, IF AN '

AssistantField Manager
APPROVE TITLE gjj\ng DAT

*See Instructions On Reverse Side

CONDITIONS
er th u ICEOF



Page 1 of 2
Well No. RW 34-34-AMU

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Operator/Company: QEP Uinta Basin Inc.

Well Name/Number: RW 34-34-AMU

API Number: 43-047-36351

Location: SWSE Sec Tship Rng.: . 34, T7S, R22E

Lease Number: UTU-00558

Agreement Name (IfApplicable): Red Wash Unit

For more specific details on notificationrequirements, please check the Conditions of
Approval for Notice to Drilland Surface Use Program.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR NOTICE TO DRILL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or
equitable titleto those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to
conduct operations thereon.

Be aware that fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or
when well is being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for
information.

Please submit an electronic copy of all logs run on this well in LAS format. This
submission will supersede the requirement for submittal of paper logs to the
BLM. The cement bond log must be submitted in raster format (TIF, PDF or
other).

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Michael Lee (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435)



Page 2 of 2
Well No. RW 34-34-AMU

Company/Operator: QEP, Uinta Basin, Inc

API Number 43-047-36351

Well Name & Number: RW 34-34 AMU

Lease number: UTU-0558

Location: SWSW Sec, M, T.LR. &

Surface Ownership: BLM

Date NOS Received: 1/27/05

Date APD Received: 3/4/05

Conditions for Approval are in the APD

To clear the proposed project from a Paleontology Program perspective, provided the
following mitigation is incorporated into the authorization: The access road will need to
be monitored during construction by an authorized



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER

UTU-0558

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F NDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° RED WASH UNIT

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER RW 34-34 AMU
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

QEP UINTA BASIN, INC 4304736351
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WLDCAT

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-4331 RED WASH
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 858 FSL 1944 FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:SWSE 34 7S 22E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENTFORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work wll start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDCN

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG AND ABANDŒ VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: APD EXTENSION
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMAT10N

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, v olumes, etc

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. hereby requests a 1 year extension on the RW 34-34 AMU

oate:

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) ASA ISOn TITLE Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE / DATE 3/9/2006

(This space for State use o )

D.Rí 3 2003
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-353Šl
Well Name: RW 34-34 AMU
Location: 858FSL 1944 FEL, SWSE, SEC. 34, T7S, R22E.
Company Permit Issued to: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
Date Original Permit Issued: 3/10/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies thatthe information as submitted in the previously
approved application todrill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Followinq is a checklistof some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONoO

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO NoZ

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of thisproposed well? YesO No2

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesO No \ZI

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? YesO NoO

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which will require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesO Nol2]

Is bondin still in place, which covers this proposed well? YesŒNoO

3/9/2006

Signa re Date

Title: REGULATORY AFFAIRS

Representing: QEP UINTA BASIN,



CONFIDENTIAL
Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES
(November 1994) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires July 31, 1996

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0558
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
N/A
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side RED WASH UNIT
1. Type of Well

Oil Well O Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name ofOperator RW 34-34 AMU
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. Contact: Jan Ne/SOn 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36351
11002 East 17500 South, Vernal, UT 84078 435-781-4331 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location ofWell (Footage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) RE D WASH
858' FSL 1944' FEL, SWSE, SECTION 34, T7S, R22E 11. County or Parish, State

Uintah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon APD EXTENSION
O Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any ptoposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measired and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
A1tach the Bond under which 1he work will be perftrmed or provide the Bond Nu on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed wahin 30 days
Following coupletion of the involved operations If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shaR be filed once
Testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shan be filed only af1er all requirements, including reclarnation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the si1e is ready for final inspection.)

QEP Uinta Basin Inc, hereby requests a 1 year extension on the APD for the RW 34-34 AMU.

BLM APO approval date: 6-15-05

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil2Gas and Adining

FORRECORDOND

CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTACHED

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Jan Nelson
'

Regulatory Affairs
Signature Date

,g May 5, 2006

Approved by

THIS SPACE FOR F RS T MEngineer
oate

conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify Office
that the applicant holds legalor equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious e

fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

(Instructions on reversd

g[gg



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-36351
Well Name: RW 34-34 AMU
Location: 858' FSL 1944' FEL, SWSE, SEC. 34, T7S, R22E.
Company Permit Issued to: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
Date Original Permit Issued: 6/15/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Followinq is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesONo2

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO Nom

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of thisproposed well? YesO NoO

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesO No 2

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? YesO NoO

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which will require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesO NoO

Is bondin still in place, which covers this proposed well? YeslZINoO

5/5/2006

Sign'ur Date

Title: REGULATORY AFFAIRS

Representing: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.

RECEIVED
MAY26 2006

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET
2. CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-QuestarE&P Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900

CA No. Unit: RED WASH UNIT

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

SEE ATTACHED LISTS *

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/31/2005
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143

5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 4/23/2007 BIA
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 4/23/2007
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.
SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xls 4/30/2007 AND



1 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Wel1Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU l (41-26B) RW 41-26B NENE
26¯

| 070S 230E 4304715135_ 5670 Federal OW TA
EDAFUf3(34-23B) PCAT34-23B SNVSE 23 070S 230E · 4304715136 5670 Federal CON P
RWU 4 (41-22B) RW 41-22B .NENE 22 070S 230E 43047 l 5137 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 5 (41-23B) RW 41-23B INENE 23 070S 230E 4304715138 5670 Federal OW P
RWU8 (32-22B) RW32-22B SWNE 22 070S 230E ' 4304715139 5670 Federal OW P
FORAJ9(43-23B) R9;r43-23B 7058E 23 070S 230E 4304715140 5670 Federal CDAT P
RWU 10 (12-23B) RW 12-23B SWNW 23 070S 230E 4304715141 5670 Federal OW TA
RTVU11 RNV34-27B SVVSE 27 070S 230E 4304715142 ,99996 Federal VVI A
RWU 13 (14-22B) RW 14-22B SWSW 22 070S 230E 43047151Ã'i5670 IFederal OW TA
RW 14-13B RW 14-13B SWSW 13 070S 230E 4304715144 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 15 (32-17C) RW 32-17C SWNE 17 070S 240E 4304715145 5670 Federal OW P
RAWIJ17(41-20B) ICAT41-20B FUEFHE 20 070S 230E 4304715146 5670 Fedend VVI A
R3WIJ19 (34-26B) BCA'34-26B STVSE 26 070S 230E 4304715148 5670 Fedend GPAr S
R1NIJ21 (32-14B) 104'32-14B S'WR(E 14 070S 230E 4304715150 5670 Fedend OVV P
RWU23(21-23B) RW21-23B SENW 23 070S 230E 4304715151 99996 Federal WI A
RTVU24(34-14B) IUM/34-14B 50¥SE 14 070S 230E 4304715152 5670 Federal OM' S
RWU 26 (23-22B) RW 23-22B |NESW 22 ' 070S , 230E 4304715153 5670 Federal OW TA
R.TVL127(43-14B) IEWT43-14B NESE 14 070S 230E 4304715154 5670 Federal (TW' 104
RWU 28 (43-22B) RW 43-22B NESE 22 070S 230E 4304715 155 5670 Federal OW P
RWU29(32-23B) RW32-23B SWNE 23 070S 230E 4304715l56 5670 Federal OW P
y gr23-13B IUM/23-13B PRESTV 13 070S 230E 4304715157 5670 Fedeñu CiW1 114
RWU 31 (34-22B) RW 34-22B SWSE 22 : 070S 230E 4304715158 5670 Federal OW P
RTVII33 (14-14B) RTV14-14B STVSTV 14 070S .230E 4304715160 5670 Federal (in'

¯
154

RNVU34(23-14B) 104'23-14B FRESVV 14 1070S 230E 4304715161 99996 Federal VVI A
RW43-13B RW43-13B NESE 13 | 0708 230E 4304715162 5670 Federal OW ITA
RWU36(32-13B) _ RW32-13B _ SWNE 13 070S 230E 4304715163 5670 Federal GW P
RWU38(14-23B) RW14-23B SWSW 23 I 0708 230E 4304715165 5670 Federal OW IP
RWU 39 (14-24A) RW 14-24A SWSW 24 070S 220E 4304715166 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU40 (21-24B) RW 21-24B NENW 24 070S 230E 4304715167 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU41 (34-13B) RW 34-13B SWSE 13 070S 230E 43047l5168 5670 Federal OW _ P
RWU42 (21-29C) RW 21-29C NENW 29 0708 240E 4304715169 5670 |Federal GW _ P
R3N1143(12-17B) RNV12-17B SNVFUN 17 070S 230E | 4304715170 5670 Fedend Cny P
RWU44 (32-33C) RW 32-33C SWNE 33 070S 240E I 4304715171 5670 Federal GW P
RWU45(23-30B) RW23-30B NESW 30 070S 230E 4304715172 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVII46(41-21C) Irgr41-21C 70ENHi 21 070S 240E 4304715173 5670 .Fedend GRW TA
RTVLI48(32-19B) ICgr32-19B SYYbHi 19 070S 230E , 4304715174 '99996 Federd TVI I
RWU 49 (12-29B) RW 12-29B SWNW 29 070S 230E 4304715175 5670 Federal _OW TA
RWU 50 (14-23A) RW 14-23A SWSW 23 070S 220E . 4304715176 | 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 52 (14-18B) RW 14-18B _ SWSW 18 070S_ 230E 4304715178 ' 5670 Federal OW TA
RTVLI53(41-25A) ICW'41-25A 70EbHi 25 070S |220E 4304715179 5670 Federal ONV TA
RTVII56(41-28B) |Ryr41-28B TUEbHi 28 070S ]230E 4304715182 99996 Fedeñd h¥I



2 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease |Well Type Status

RNVU57(12-18C) RVV12-18C STVbBW 18 070S 240E 4304715183 : 5670 Federal fint P
RWU63(21-22B) RW21-22B NENW 22 070S 230E 4304715186 5670 Federal IGW TA
RWU64 (32-27B) RW 32-27B SWNE 27 070S 230E 4304715187 5670 |Federal OW TA
RWU 66 (34-18B) RW 34-18B SWSE 18 070S 230E 4304715189 5670 Federal , OW P
RWU 67_(42-22B) RW 42-22B SENE 22 070S 230E 4304715190 | 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 69 (21-27B) RW 21-27B NENW 27 070S 230E 4304715191 5670 Federal IOW TA
5041170(23-22A.) Ifni23-22A PEESTV 22 070S 220E 4304715192 5670 Fedend ONV P
R3VIJ71 (21-18C) PC¾r21-18C ÞBEbDN 18 070S i240E 4304715193 5670 Federal CAN P
RWU 72 (23-27B) RW 23-27B NESW 27 070S i 230E 4304715194 5670 Federf OW TA
RNVIJ74(12-13B) __ R1V12-13B S)V>DN 13 070S 230E 4304715196 5670 Federal ÕN S
RWU 75 (21-26B) RW 21-26B NENW 26 070S 230E 4304715197 5670 _Federal OW TA
REVIJ76(32-18C) RM/32-18C SNVfDE 18 070S !240E 4304715198 I 5670 Fedend GPN P
RWU 77 (21-13B) RWU 77 (21-13B) NENW 13 070S 230E 4304715199 5670 Federal OW P
I ŸUr78 (32-28B} R3¥32-28B SYVIEE 28 070S , 230E 4304715200 5670 Fedend CON P
RWU 79 (12-27B) RW 12-27B SWNW 27 070S 230E 4304715201 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 80 (14-27B) RW 14-27B SWSW 27 0705 230E 4304715202 5670 Federal OW S
ILVVLIB1(41-318) PD¥4l-31B ÞUEFEE 31 i 070S , 230E 4304715203 5670 Federal CAN P
RAWIJ83 (41-27/L) IED¥41-27/L PHENHi 27 070S |220E 4304715205 5670 Federal CON P
RNVL184(44-14B) .RMr44-14B SESE 14 070Š 230E 4304715206 5670 Fedend GBY P
9041988 (23-18B) 1906723-18B FUESTV 18 070S 230E 4304715210 5670 Fedend TVI At
R341790 (43-21B) R= v43-21B FUESE 21 070S 230E 4304715211 5670 Federal CAF P
RWU92 (ll-23B) RW 11-23B NWNW 23 I 070S 230E 4304715212 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU94 (l2-22A) iRW 12-22A SWNW 22 I 070S 220E 4304715213 5670 'Federal OW P
RTVU23-18C(97) IICyr23-18C NESVV | 18 070S 240E 4304715216 99996 Federal DNI I
BOA1J99(12-22B) IITV 12-22B SNVlivV 22 i 0708 230E 4304715218 5670 Federal ()?V JP
ILYYL1100-/t(43-21AO Ri¥43-21/t 70ESE 21 070S 220E 4304715219 5670 Federal TVI A
RWU 101 (34-21B) IRW34-21B SWSE 21 070S 230E 4304715220 5670 Federal OW P
ILVill102 (41-24/k) R'A'41-24A SEliE 24 070S 220E 4304715221

.
5670 Federal TVI A

R'ROJ103 (34-15B) R3¥34-15B STVSE 15 0708 230E 4304715222 | 5670 Federal (39V P
RWU 108 (32-21B) RW 32-21B SWNE , 21 0708 230E 4304715226 5670 Federal OW P
R3NIJl09 (21-28B) 1(gr21-28B NEDWTV 28 070S 230E 4304715227 5670 Fedenal Cygt p
R'ARJl10(23-23/O IEWT23-23A bnESNV 23 070S 220E 4304715228 5670 Fedend CON P
ILUVLIl11(32-24/0 R3¥32-24/L SVV}BE , 24 070S 220E 4304715229 | 5670 Fedend CDA' S
RWU 112 (32-28A) RW 32-28A ISWNE I 28 070S 220E 4304715230 5670 Federal OW S
RNVill15(21-19B) 104721-19B II(EFTWT | 19 070S 230E 4304715233 5670 Federal Cn¥ P
R' RJ119(43-29/O Itat43-29A PUESE 29 070S 220E 4304715236 5670 Fedeñd CON P
RAVIJ120 (23-28B) Icar23-28B bHESNV 28 070S |230E 4304715237 5670 Fedeñd (yw; T,4
R'RI 13-13B R1Af13-13B Pf?VSTV 13 070S 230E 4304715238 5670 1FederÑl(39V P
RNVUl22(24-14B) I gr24-14B SESlN 14 070S |230E 4304715239 5670 ,Fedend ONV P
RWU 125 (34-19B) RW 34-19B SWSE _19 070S 230E 4304715242 5670 Federal IOW |TA
RNVIJ126(41-29/O R3¥41-29/t f(ETIE 29 070S I 220E 4304715243 5670 Federal 139V



3 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease 'Well Type Status

R1VIJ127 (12-191¥) 119V12-19B SNVIfyV 19 070S 230E 4304715244 5670 Federdl ()VV IS
RWU 129 (14-15B) RVÏ14-15B _ SWSW 15 070S 230E 4304715246 5670 Federal OW IP
RWU l33 (41-34B) RW 41-34B NENE 34 070S 230E 4304715250 5670 Federal OW |P
RIVIJ136(43-19B) fin'43-19B IfESE 19 070S 230E 4304715252 5670 Fedend lONV TA

¯

RWU 137 (34-28B) RW 34-28B ISWSE 28 070S 230E 4304715253 5670 Federal GW TA
RTVIJl38(41-30B) 104'41-30B FBINE 30 070S 230E 4304715254 5670 Fedend lONV P
RWU 140 (24-22B) RW 24-22B SESW 22 070S 230E | 4304715255 | 5670 Federal .OW P
RWU 141 (ll-27B) RW ll-27B 'NWNW 27 070S 230E 4304715256 | 5670_ Federal ,OŸV

¯
TA

REVIJ143 (33-l(B) EUAT33-14B lilVSE 14 070S 230E ' 4304715257 5670 IFederal ()?V P
RWU l44 (21-18B) RW21-18B

INENW¯
18 070S 230E ' 4304715258 5670 |Federal OW |TA

ICW'24-13B IEnf24-13B SESTV 13 0705 230E 4304715259 | 5670 Fedenal CB¥ |TA
RWU 147 (22-22B) RW 22-22B ISENW 22 070S 230E 4304715260 5670 Federal OW :TA
RWU 148 (13-22B) RW 13-22B NWSW 22 070S 230E 4304715261 , 99996 Federal Wl A
RTVill50(31-22B) Ifn131-22B bnNIBE 22 070S 230E 4304715263 99996 Fedend VVI 1
RWU 151 (42-14B) RW 42-14B SENE 14 070S 230E 4304715264

5670¯ ¯
ederal OW P

83An]I53 (14-29B) EDA'14-29B STVS3V ' 29 070S 230E 4304715265 5670 Federal ()VV P
ICROJl56(23-15B) I gr23-15B FEESVV i 15 '070S 230E 4304715267 99990 Fedend AWT A
RWU 158 (32-30B) RW 32-30B SWNE 30 . 070S 230E 4304715268 5670 Federal OW P
ICROJ160(32-15B) R%f32-15B SYVNE 15 i070S 230E 43047Ï52705670 Federal ,ONV P
R1NIJl61(14-20B) RTVl=‡-20B SVVSM1 20 070S 230E 4304715271 99996 Fedomi ¥I I
RWU 162 (12-20B) RW 12-20B SWNW 20 070S 230E 4304715272 5670 Federal OW P
ÈWU 164 (12-28B) RW 12-28B SWNW 28 Ò70S 230E 4304715274 5670 Federal OW

¯
P

RWU 165 (32-26B) RW 32-26B SWNE 26 070S 230E 4304715275 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 167 (23-21B) RW 23-21B NESW 21 0708 230E 4304715277 5670 Federal OW S
RWU 168 (23-24B) RW 23-24B NESW 24 070S 230E 4304715278 5670 Federal OW TA
R3An]172(21-30B) 90¥21-30B FDEPTWT 30 0708 230E 4304715280 5670 Federal OYV T/t
RTVIJ174(21-20B) R'Ar21-20B bnEbi?/ 20 0708 230E 4304715281 5670 Federal TVI \
90A1] 176(31-28B) R'Af31-28B li?V>EE 28 070S 230E 4304715283 5670 Federal EÏYV TA
RWU 177 (42-28B) _ _ _ RW 42-28B SENE 28 070S 230E 4304715284 5670 Federal OW TA
RTV22-13B R3¥22-13B SE249V 13 070S 230E 4304715285 5670 Federal (19V TA
RWU 180 (31-23B) RW 31-23B NWNE 23 070S 230E 4304715287 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 181 (34-30B) RW 34-30B SWSE 30 070S 230E 4304715288 5670 Federal OW P
R'A'33-13B RAW33-13B 749VSE I 13 070S 230E 4304715289 5670 Fedenal vvI /t

¯

RWU 184 (23-26B) iRW 23-26B NESW 26 070S I 230E 4304715290 5670 Federal iGW S
RWU 188 (23-20B) RW 23-20B NESW 20 070S 230E 4304715291 5670 Federal OW _ TA
RWU 192 (41-33A) RW 41-33A _ NENE | 33

,
070S 220E 4304715294 i 5670 Federal OW , P

RWU 193 (43-24B) RW 43-24B NESE 24 | 070S 230E 4304715295 5670 Federal GW TA
R.lVil194(12-14B) RNV12-14B SVVADW 14 070S 230E 4304715296 5670 Fedend COW S
90A1] 196(23-17C) R'Af23-17C ÞUESVV 17 070S 240E . 4304715298 5670 Fedend GA¥ TA
RWU 199 (43-22A) RW 43-22A NESE 22 070S 220E , 4304715301 99996 Federal WÌ A
RMTU201 (32-28C) EDW32-28C iSYVITE 28 070S 240E I 4304715302 5670 Federal (39V



4 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU 202 (21-34A)
¯

RW 21-34A |NENW 34 0708 220E 4304715303 9996 Federal WI I
EURGJ204(23-25As) ICA'23-25As bnESTV 25 070S 220E 4304715305 5670 Fedend CON P
RVVU205(23-21C) ¡Qgr23-21C bHESNV 21 070S 240E 4304715306 5670 Fedend__ G'N TA
RNVU2(144b‡B) ED¥144L4B STVSNV 24 070S 230E 4304716472 99996 Fedend VVI A
RTVU7(41-2 3) RMT41-27B 1dENŒl 27 070S 230E 4304716473 99996 Fedeñd GVI I
RWU 16 (43-28B) RW43-28B INESE 28 070S 230E 43047 I6475 99996 Federal WI I
RWU 25 (23-23B) RW 23-23B NESW 23 070S 230E 4304716476 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 59 (12-24B) RW 12-24B SWNW 24 070S 230E 4304716477 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 61 (12-27A) RW 12-27A SWNW 27 070S 220E 4304716478 99996 Federal WI I
RWU 91 (33-22B) RW 33-22B ,NWSE 22 070S 230E 4304716479 99996 Federal WI A
RWU 93 (43-27B _ RW 43-27B _ 'NESE 27 070S 230E 4304716480 99996 Federal WI

¯
I

¯

RWU 6 (41-21B) RW 4 I-21B 'NENE 21 070S 230E 4304716482 99996 Federal WI A
RWU68 (41-13B) RW41-13B NENE 13 070S 230E 4304716485 99996 Federal WI II
RWU 170 (41-15B) RW 41-15B NENE 15 070S 230E 4304716495 99996 Federal WI |I
RWU 173 (21-21B) RW 21-21B NENW 21 070S 230E 4304716496 | 99996 Federal WI A
RWU l82 (14-21B) RW 14-21B SWSW 21 070S 230E 4304716497 i 99996 Federal WI A
Ifn11185(41-lB) Ifn'41-14B POEbHi 14 070S 230E 4304716498 99996 |Fedend 97I A
RTVU212(41-8F) 104'41-8F TUEbHi 08 080S 240E 4304720014 5670 Fedentl Gl¥ PR¯WU

213 (41-33B) RW 41-33B NENE 33 070S 230E 4304720060 99996 Federal WD A
RWU 215 (43-28A) RW 43-28A NES_E 28 070S 220E 4304730058 99996 Federal WD A
RNVII216(21-27A) ICn'21-27A FRENIV 27 070S 220E 4304730103 99996 Fedeñd VVI A
ECBnl219(-44-21C) R3¥44-21C SESE 21 070S 240E 4304730149 5670 Federal (39V S
RTVLI220(22-23B) R'A'22-23B SE241V

.
23 070S 230E 4304730192 5670 Fedend ONV TA

RWU221(13-27B) RW13-27B NWSW 27 · 070S 230E 4304730199 5670 Federal IOW iTA
RWU 222 (31-27B) RW 31-27B NWNE 27 0708 230E 4304730200 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU224(44-22B) RW44-22B SESE 22 070S 230E 4304730202 5670 Federal IGW TA
RWU 225 (13-23B) RW 13-23B _ NWSW 23 070S 230E 4304730212 5670 Federal ,GW TA
RWU 226 (24-23B) RW 24-23B SESW 23 , 0705 230E 4304730249 5670 |Federal GW S
RWU 227 (14-26B) RW 14-26B SWSW 26 0708 230E 4304730257 5670 'Federal |OW TA
RWU 228 (21-34B) RW 21-34B NENW 34 0708 230E 4304730258 5670 Federal OW P
EURTU229(43-26B) R3F43-26B FUESE 26 070S 230E 4304730259 5670 Federal CilAf TA
RTVU230(14-18C) RVV14-18C SVVSVV 18 070S 240E 4304730309 5670 Federal OlN P
RWU 231 (21-35B) RW 21-35B INENW 35 070S 230E 4304730310 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 232 (12-26B) RW 12-26B _ SWNW 26 070S i 230E 4304730311 5670 Federal OW ÌA
RWU 233 (12-25B) RW 12-25B SWNW 25 070S '

230E . 4304730312 5670 _ Federal OW TA
EURTU234 (32-24B) EL'A'32-24B SNVTfE 24 070S 230E I 4304730313 5670 Federal ()?V P
RTVII235 (34-18C) RET34-18C STVSE 18 070S 240E 4304730314 5670 Fedend CAW S
RTVU236 (21-19C) ¡Qgr21-19C FEBFP¥ 19 070S 240E 4304730340 5670 Feden11 GON P
RWU 237 (14-25B) RW 14-25B SWSW 25 070S 230E 4304730341 5670 Federal OW IP
RWU238 (32-35B) RW32-35B SWNE 35 070S 230E 4304730342 5670 Federal OW :TA
RWU 239 (41-35B) RW 41-35B NENE 35 I 0708 230E 4304730343 5670 Federal IOW



5 of 7 QEP UintaBasin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
REDWASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RWU 240 (12-36B) RW 12-36B SWNW 36 070S 230E 4304730344 5670 Federal OW S
RTVLi241(22-14B) RAW22-14B SEf49V 14 0708 230E 4304730345 5670 Federal ()M/ P
itW'42-13B IERT42-13B SEffE 13 _ 070S 230E 4304730346 5670 Fedygý tini P
RlVIJ243 (42-18C) 104'42-18C SEldE 18 0705 240E 4304730347 5670 Fedend COW TA
RTVU244(23-19C) ECn'23-19C 70ESTV 19 0708 240E 4304730348 5670 Fedgnd GRW P
RWU 246 (22-18C) RW 22-18C_ _ SENW 18 0708 240E 4304730387 5670 Federal OW P
R1VIJ247(22-17C) IEW'22-17C SER49V 17 0708 240E 4304730388 5670 Fedend GYV P
RWU 258 (34-22A) RW 34-22A SWSE I 22 0708 220E 4304730458 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 262 (22-26B) RW 22-26B SENW 26 0708 230E 4304730517 5670 Federal GW iTA
RMŒJ263(24-26B) RTV24-26B SESYV 26 070S 230E 14304730518 99996 Feden] TVI I
RWU 264 (31-35B) RW 31-35B INWNE 35 070S 230E 4304730519 99996 Federal WI A
RTVU265(44-26B) ION44-26B SESE 26 070S 230E 4304730520 5670 Federdl Gyv P
RWU 266 (33-26B) RW 33-26B .NWSE 26 0708 230E 4304730521 99996 Federal WI i1
RWU 269 (13-26B) RW 13-26B NWSW 26 070S 230E I 4304730522 99996 FetÏeralWI A
RWU273(42-27B) RW42-27B _ SENE 27 070S 230E 4304731051 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVU279(11-36B) RNV11-36B BPAff9/ 36 070S 230E 4304731052 99996 Federal \NI A
RWU 276 (44-27B) RW 44-27B SESE 27 070S 230E 4304731053 5670 Feil OW TA
RWU 272 (44-23B) RW 44-23B SESE 23 070S 230E 4304731054 5670 Federal GW P
RVVU278(11-26) RVV11-26 FinfilV 26 070S 230E 4304731076 5670 Federd GON TA
RVVU275(31-26B) 1FD¥31-26B blAfdE 26 070S 230E 4304731077 99996 Fedenal VVI A
RWU 280 (11-35B) 'RW 11-35B NWNW 35 070S 230E 4304731079 5670 Federal OW P
RWU282 (42-26B) RW42-26B SENE 26 070S 230E 4304731080 5670 Federal GW ITA
RWU 271 (42-35B) RW 42-35B SENE 35 0708 230E . 430473108 1 5670 Federal WI l
RWU 270 (22-35B) iRW 22-35B SENW 35 0708 230E | 4304732082 5670 Federal OW P
RWU284 (33-23B) IRW 33-23B NWSE 23 0708 230E 4304731476 5670 'Federal GW TA
RWU 285 (11-24B) RW l l-24B NWNW 24 0708 230E

.

430473 I477 5670 IFederal OW P
RWU 286 (42-21B) RW 42-21B _ SENE 21 0708 230E I 430473147_8 5670 Federal OW P
g9gr44-13B ED¥44-13B SESE 13 070S 230E 4304731512 5670 Federal CON TARWU2_8B24-27) RW24-27 SESW ,27 070S230E 4304731513 5670Federal OW TA
RWU289 (13-24B) RW 13-24B INWSW 24 070S 230E 4304731517 5670 Federal OW P
RWU292(42-23B) RW42-23B :SENE 23 070S 230E 4304731576 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 295 (11-22B) RW 11-22B |NWNW 22 070S 230E 4304731577 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 296 (12-35B) RW 12-35B SWNW 35 I 070S 230E 4304731578 5670 Federal OW S
RWU 297 (24-15B) RW 24-15B SESW 15 070S 230E 4304731579 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 293 (22-22A) RW 22-22A SENW 22 070S 220E 4304731581 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 294 (24-18C) RW 24-18C SESW 18 070S 240E 4304731582 5670 Federal GW (P
RWU 298 (22-27B) RW 22-27B SENW 27 | 070S 230E 430473 I679 5670 Federal OW ITA
RWU 301 (43-15B) RW 43-15B NESE 15 0708 230E | 4304731682 5670 Federal GW TA
RWU 302 (22-24B) RW 22-24B SENW 24 0708 230E 4304731683 5670 Federal iGW TA
RTVIJ303(34-17B) R'n'34-17B SVVSE 17 0708 230E 4304731819 5670 Federal OVV P
RED WASH 305 (41-4F) RW41-4F C-NE 04 080S 240E 4304732538 5670 Federal GW



6 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name ß¾ 9 Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RED WASH 306 RW 23-23C NESW 23 070S 240E 4304732629 5670 _Fe_deral GW P
RTVII207 RTV14-17B EDNSDW 17 0708 230E 4304732738 5670 Federal Cygr p
RED WASH UNIT 261 RW 23-17B NESW 17 0708 230E 4304732739 5670 Federal WI A
RNVIJ268(43-17B) ICRT43-17B 10ESE 17 0708 230E 4304732980 5670 Federed VVI A
RNVIJ267(32-17B) EER'32-17B STVIDE 17 0708 2

Õ¯
4304732981 5670 Federed Cygr p

RTVII283(43-18B) ECn'43-18B FUESE 18 0708 230E 4304732982 5670 Federal \NI A
RTVLI299(32-18B) IEWF32-18B STV>HE 18 0708 230E 4304733018 5670 Fedend ONV P
RWU42-20B RW42-20B SENE 20 070S 230E 4304733490 5670 IFederal ÒW P
RWU 22-20B RW 22-20B SENW 20 070S 230E I 4304733491 | 5670 Federal OW

¯
S

BOWU24-19B _ RMT24-19B SESTV 19 .070S 230E : 4304733492 5670 Federal ONV P
FDWil13-19B RIVl3-19B b5VSVV 19 070S 230E 4304733497 5670 Federal 3NI A
RWU 13-20B RW 13-20B NWSW 20 0 Ï0S 230E 4304733498 5670 Federal WI A
IUMTU33-19B 90¥33-19B If?VSE i 19 070S 230E 4304733499 5670 Federal VVI A
BOWIJ33-20B JU%F33-20B If?TSE 20 070S 230E 4304733500 5670 Federal TVI A
RED WASH 22-21B RW 22-21B SENW 21 070S 230E 4304733522 5670 Federal OW S
RED WASH 24-20B |RW 24-20B SESW 20 070S 230E 4304733523 5670 Federal OW P
REDi¥rtSH44-19B IRi¥44-19B SESE 19 070S 230E 4304733524 5670 Fedend Cfni P
RED WASH 44-20B RW 44-20B SESE 20 070S 230E 4304733525 5670 Federal OW P
R3V1111-19B lIET11-19B NMnNNV 19 070S 230E 4304733552 5670 ,Fedend $NI A
RWU 11-20B RW 11-20B NWNW 20 0708 230E 4304733553 5670 Federal WI A
RTVU24-18B gegv24-18B SESTV 18 070S 230E 4304733554 | 5670 Fedenal CON P
RNVIJ31-19B I gr31-19B FPATUE 19 070S 230E 4304733555 5670 .Fedend 1NI A
RWU42-19B RWÄ2-19B SENE 19 070S 230E 4304733556 i 5670 IFederal OW P
RWU 22-19B RW 22-19B SENW 19 070S 230E 4304733559 5670 IFederal OW P
RYYLT23-24/s y gr23-24/L FRESVV 24 070S 220E 4304733567 [ 5670 Federa (197 P
RWU 34-24A RW 34-24A SWSE 24 070S 220E 4304733568 i 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 42-24A RW 42-24A SENE 24 070S 220E i 4304733569 5670 Federal OW S
RTVIJ11-25A Iggr11-25A NTAS41V 25 070S 220E 4304733574 5670 Fedenal 97I A
ICBILfl3-25/k ICUV13-25/t FIRTSTV 25 070S 220E 4304733575 5670 Federal VV1 A
RWU 21-25A RW 21-25A NENW 25 070S 220E 4304733576 5670 Federal OW P
ÏCWIJ31-25A BER'31-25A FDAT(E 25 070S 220E 4304733577 5670 Fedend VVI A
RWU 33-25A RW 33-25A NWSE 25 070S 220E 4304733578 5670 iFederal WI A
RW 41-25AX RW 41-25A NENE 25 070S 220E 4304733579 5670 Federal OW P
RWU 42-25A RWU 42-25A SENE 25 0708 220E 4304733580 5670 Federal OW TA
RWU 11-29B RW 11-29B NWNW 29 0708 230E 4304733590 5670 Federal WI A
RWU 12-24A RW 12-24A SWNW 24 070S 220E '

4304733591 5670 Federal VÌI A
RVVU21-24A EUR?21-24/k f(Ebint 24 070S 220E 4304733592 5670 Fedend CON P
RNVII34-13A RM/34-13A STVSE 13 070S 220E 4304733593 5670 Fedend TVI A
RVVU44-18B 104744-18B SESE 18 1070S 230E | 4304733594 5670 Fedend Crni P
KM/22-13A RMF22-13A SEgggr 13 070S 220E 4304733765 13296 Fedend ONV S
RWU 22-29B RW 22-29B SENW 29 070S I 230E 4304733766 5670 Federal OW



7 of 7 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RTVLI41-24A Unr41-24A PEEbHi 24 070S | 220E 4304733769 5670 Éederal ONV _ P
RVVU42-30B Flaf42-30B SEhdB 30 070S 230E 4304733771 5670 Fedend CAW P
EUMTU44-30B ICP/U44-30B SESE 30 070S 230E 4304733772 5670 Federal ()VV

¯
P

RNVUll-30B RNVll-30B FTWGini 30 070S 230E 4304733785 5670 Federal TVI A
Etwitr22-25/t R3¥22-25/t SE249V i 25 070S 220E 4304733786 5670 Federal (39V P
RYYLT31-30B gygr31-30B bfüQbHi | 30 070S 230E 4304733788 5670 Federal OFI A
90WU33-30B þD¥33-30B If?/SE 30 070S 230E 4304733790 5670 Fedend DNI A
RED WASH U 34-27C RW 34-27C SWSE 27 070S 240E 4304735045 5670 Federal GW P
RWU 34-22C RW 34-22C SWSE 22 i 070S 240E 4304735098 5670 Federal GW P
RTV12Gi-20C IUWil2G-20C SMnNIV 20 \070S 240E 4304735239 14011 Federal GNV S
ECW'43GË-08F IUMT43Gi-08F PRESE 08 080S 240E 4304735655 Fedeñu GNV Ad?D
ECgr22Gi-09F y gr22Gi-09F SEff?/ 09 0808 240E 4304735656 15636 Fedend G'N OPS
BOA1J34-23/sG ItWV34-23AvG

_

:SVVSE 23 070S 220E 4304735668 5670 Federal ()MT P
RWU 34-27AG RWU 34-27AD ISWSE 27 070S 220E 4304735669 ' 5670 Federal OW DRL
RWU 32-27AG RWU 32-27AG _ SWNE 27 070S 220E

,

4304735670 5670 Federal OW _ S
RW 14-34AMU RW 14-34AMU SWSW 34 070S 220E '

4304735671 [ 14277 Federal GW P
RTV12-08FG RTV12-08FG SVENIV 08 080S '240E 4304736348 , Fedenal GR¥ Ad13
RNV44-08FG RTV=M-08FG SESE 08 080S 240E 4304736349 15261 Federal GNV P
RVV12-17FG 100/12-17FG STV>D¥ 17 080S i240E 4304736350 Fedend GNV APD
RW 34-34 AMU RW 34-34 AD SWSE 34 070S 220E 4304736351 Federal GW APD
RW 44-35 AMU RW 44-35 AMU SESE 35 070S 220E 4304736352 Federal GW APD
RW 14-35 AMU RW 14-35 AMU SWSW 35 070S 220E 4304736354 Federal GW APD
RW33-31 BMU RW 33-31 BD NWSE 31 070S 230E 4304736357 Federal GW APD
RW 13-31 BMU 'RW 13-3] BD NWSW 31 ÜÑŠ 230E 4304736358 Federal GW APD
RW 32-15FG ,RW 32-15FG SWNE 15 0803 240E 4304736443 Federal GW APD
RW 21-26AG RW 21-26AD NENW 26 0708 220E 4304736768 Federal OW APD
EØF43-26Ad3 RM/43-26/03 PUESE 26 0708 220E 4304736769 Fedend COW AJUD
RW 43-23AG RW 43-23AG NESE 23 070S 2201 4304736770 Federal OW APD
RN¥41-26/90 _BD¥41-26/vG PLEbnB 26 0708 220E 4304736818 Federal OM/ 70PD
RW 04-25BG -RW 04-25B NWSW 25 0708 230E 4304736982 Federal OW APD
RW 01-25BG RW 01-25BG NWNW 25 070S 230E 4304736983 Federal OW APD
RW 04-26BG RW04-26BG SESW 26 070S i 230E 4304736984 Federal OW APD
RW 01-26BG RW 01-26BG SWNW 26 070S 230E 4304736985 Federal OW APD
RW 01-35BG RW 01-35BG ISWNW 35 070S 230E 4304736986 Federal IOW



1 of 1 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
RED WASH UNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

RIVIJ51(12-16B) BON12-16B SYVfDN 16 070S 230E 4304715177 5670 Sute ONV P
RWU ST 189 (41-16B) RW 41-16B

¯
NENE 16 070S 230E 4304715292 5670 State OW S

RED WASH UNIT 259 RW 14-16B SWSW_ 16 070S 230E 4304732785 5670 State -OW _ LP
RED WASH UNIT 260 RW 34-16B SWSE 16 070S 230E 4304732786 5670 State OW .P
RWU324 (23-16B) RW 23-16B SESW 16 070S 230E 4304733084 5670 State WI OP

¯

R1 U21W-36A RWU21W-36A NENW 36 070S 220E 4304733730 State |GW :LA
RWU 21G-36A RWU 21G-36A NENW 36 | 070S 220E 4304733731 .State OW LA
RYTLT41-36/s IEBfLT41-36/t PLEFEE 36 . 070S 220E 4304733732 Sutte ()?V 1-4
RTVLI43-16B RVVLI43-16B PUESE 16 070S '230E [ 4304733733 State CON _ LA
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RWU 13-36A RWU 13-36A NWSW 36 070S 220E 4304733737 State OW LA
ECn'32Gr-16C ICRr32G-16C STVIDE , 16 070S 240E. 4304735238 5670 State GAV P
RW 14-36AMU RW 14-36AMU .SWSW 36 070S 220E 4304736721 State GW APD
Ifn'01-36BI3

¯
ICnr01-36BI3 'TivnSTV 36 0708 230E 4304736887 5670 SLte CD¥ S

RW 24-16BG RW 24-16BG ISESW 16 070S 230E 4304737746 5670 Stat OW DRL
RW 12-32BG RW 12-32BG |SWNW 32 070S 230E

'
4304737946 15841 State 'GW



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IFINDIAN ALhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use this form for proposals to dritinew wells,significantly deepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells,or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals. See attached

1. TYPE OF WELL - - 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER;OIL WELL [_| GAS WELL [_,j OTHER see attached
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR 9. API NUMBER.
QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 ,. , Denver sy,,, CO , 80265 (303) 308-3068

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached couNTY: Ulntah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart; CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STAYUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Operator Name
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record,QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., willhereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. Thls name change involves onlyan internal corporate name change and no thirdparty
change of operator is involved. The same employeeswillcontinue to be responsible for operatlonsof the properties described
on theattached list. AIIoperations willcontinuetobe covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965003033 ,

Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operatorof record, QEP UINTABASIN, IN , hereby r signs as operatorof the properties as described on the
attached list.

Ja , es , Executive Vice President, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIO ND PO UCTIONCOMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligations as operator of the propertles as descr ed on the ttachedlist

Jayf. Neese, Exec tiveVice President
Q6estar Exploration and Production Company

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) D rSK. Stanberry ; ) TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATI.lRE DATE 3/16/2007

(This spaeo for Stato use only)

RECFVE
APR1 3 2007

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Slde)

DN.0FOL,GAS



STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL.NUMBER:
see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS NDAN Lht0TTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to See attacheddrill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:1 TYPEOFWELL
OIL WELL Q GAS WELL Q OTHER see attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR. 9. API NUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver sy,,, CO 80265 (303) 308-3068

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE 8ÍtBChed COUNTY; Ulntah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHERDATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submitin Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATORCHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK O WATER DISPOSAL(SubmitoriginalForm Only)
CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMAflONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Name Changes
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED ORCOMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinent details including dates, deptils, volurnes,etc.

PER THE ATTACHEDLIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTS THAT THE
INDIVIDUALWELL NAMES BE UPDATED INYOUR RECORDS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) O , TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE
.. --. 4/17/2007

(This space for State use only)

RECEfVED
APR18 2007(See instructions on ReverseSide

DN.OF016GAS&MINiNG



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office T^KE DE
P.O. Box 45155 "Am emcA

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

April 23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as Unit Operator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor Unit Operator for the Red Wash Unit,Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effectiveApril23, 2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the

designated party has obtained all requiredapproval thatwouldentitle itto conductoperations under
the Red Wash UnitAgreement.

Yournationwideoiland gas bond No. ESBOOOO24willbe used to cover allfederal operations within
the Red Wash Unit.

It is requested that you notifyall interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriatefederal offices,with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

/s/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
ActingChief, Branch of FluidMinerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil,Gas &Mining
File - Red Wash Unit(wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron ggcélVED
Reading File
Central Files ggg 30 2ÛÛÎ

UT922:TAThompson:tt:4/23/07

g¿ OFOg CAS&



CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.

Notice of Intent
APD Extension

Lease: UTU-0558 (43-047-36351)
Well: RW 34-34 AMU
Location: SWSE Sec 34-TO7S-R22E

An extension for the referenced APD is granted with the following conditions:

1. The extension and APD shall expire on 06/15/2007

2. No other extension shall be granted.

If you have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Roger Hall of this office at
(435) 781-4470 or email Roger



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0558

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 F INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do notuse thisform for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to RED WASH UNITdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER RW 34-34 AMU

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QEP UINTA BASIN, INC 4304736351
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1571 E. 1700 S· civv VERNAL STATE UT ziP84078 (435) 781-4031 RED WASH
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 858 FSL 1944 FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWSE 34 7S 22E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date wodt willstait: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: APD EXTENSION
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. hereby requests a 1 year extension on the RW 34-34 AMU.

Approved by the
Utah Divisionof

Oil,Gas and Mining

Date: $~¾
By:

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Laura Bills TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE 3/15/2007

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompanythe Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43-047-36351
Well Name: RW 34-34 AMU
Location: 858 FSL 1944 FEL, SWSE, SEC.34 T7S R22E.
Company Permit Issued to: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.
Date Original Permit Issued: 3/10/2005

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application,which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes O No IZI

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO NolZI

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the
permitting or operation of thisproposed well? YesONolZI

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesONo121

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged? YesO NolZI

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? YesONolZI

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Yesl2]NoO

Title: REGULATORY ASSISTANT

Representing: QEP UINTA BASIN, INC.

MAR1 9



SENT BY: 0EP W0NSITSVALLEY; 435 781 4357; JUN-12-07 12:31PM; PAGE1/2
ro..xm UNITEDSTATES
o..'*l") ~

DEPARTMENTOPTHEINTERIOR a.4,. n

BUREAUOPLANDMANAGEMENT

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Donotuse this form ibr proposals to drill or todeepenor reentrytoa differentreservoir

Use"APPLICATIONPORPERMIT--" for suchproposals y a.... m.n...
N/A

SF/BMIT1N TRIPLICATE ' rumoreA Dom

ou om RED WANI Warr

O - U - O Name

RW3&s4 Anto
2 Na-edep-mar

QUENTAREzrLOR&nON &FROÞUCTION, CO. ; AN W@No

M*sps-dWu¢iameN. Contact: Dahn.Caldwell@guestar.oom ==1
1571E.170ta-VERNAI.UT 84078.8826 435-TS1430 pu 435-TB1-43gy mmdamatustarkipiersmuyAma

4. Leados ofWe woemersea.T., R..K.or ammy4) UNDESIGNATED

$58' PSL, 1944' PEI, SWSE, SEC WT7&R22E li.Am..y.rsa.am

UINTAB, UTAR

n CEIECKAPPROPRIATEB 3X(s)TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, )R OTHER DATA
TYR OP SUBhDSSION TYPEOP ACflON

O Nog Mme

O -'- O -

U"- O- · 0-
0 -- 0 --

U°-- 0--
OleagawanamnimetselA¢.se.wisdomonwd

., comiellenorheempiegpam.n..itana..)
13. Ottellbo fiopoesi orConipilledOppugang(Cissigsageat panhiansduimils,md gin puduma W imahdhg medianeddas ofsmtigmy poposed wak. Ewei isdhucila-ly eBEL

glwanbensheelenignasatme-medandsueveniculdspás r-Emaders-dansesperds-ate iswedd

On 6M/07 - Drilled 40'of 24" conducier hole. Set 40' of 20" conductor pipe. Cement w/ Ready Mix.

RECEIVED
JUN1 2 2007

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING
a-saas,2-UtahÓCAhl,1-55e-ver,I- e Wordseerver

i

14 y endg entthennesiasiasme
Dahn F. Caldwell OfEies Administrator H """ 6/8/07

(Ithspueshiredmier Musemosus4
Annovelar: was nais
c..mi....rmy...d.r..y

Tille15U.S.C.Sealloa100I, aalma a silmeformaypman blowinglyandwlNMiy14athetoanydepartmenter agnacyofthe Un alaicaeatsor
supresmiedensesse anyastier withisils



State of Utah OPERATOR ACCT. No. N-5085
Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: Questar Exploration & Production, Co.

ADDRESS: 1571 East 1700 South
ENTlTYACTION FORM - FORM 6 Vernal, Utah 84078-8526 (435)781-4342

Action Current New Entity API Number Well Name QQ SC TP RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No.

No.
99999 43½47-36351 RW 34-34 AMU SWSE 34 7S 22E Uintah 6/7/07

WELL 1 COMMENTS: WSMVD
"" CONFllENTIAL

WELL2 COMMENTS:

WELL 3 COMMENTS: 2

WELL 4 COMMENTS:

I Illi I
WELL 5 COMMENTS:

ACTION CODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only)
B - Add new well to existingentity (groupor unit well)
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity toanotherexistingentity nature
D - Re-assign well from one existing entitytoa newentity
E - Other (explainin commentssection) Office Administrator II 6/8/07

Title Date
NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected

Phone No. (4351781-4342
(3/89)



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(November 1994) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Ô.iiii
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0558
Do not use this form for proposals to driu or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
N/A
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Ofher Instructions on reverse sicie RED WASH UNIT
1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator RW 34-34AMU
QUESTAR EXPLORATION &PRODUCTION, CO. 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36351
11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078 435-781-4331 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T , R., M., or SurveyDescription) UNDESIGNATED
858' FSL 1944' FEL SWSE SECTION 34, T7S, R22E 11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent
¯¯¯|

Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon NAMECHANGE
Final Abandonment Notice

|¯¯|
Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

l3 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any pmposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomple1e horizontally, give subsurface locations and meamred and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones

Attach the Bond under which the work will be perfumed or provide the Bond Na on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
Following completion of the involved operations If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Fœm 3160-4 shall be filed once
Testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afler all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY (QEP) REQUEST PERMISSION TO CHANGE THE DRILLING
PLANS FOR THIS WELL AND TO USE OIL BASE MUDFOR THE DRILLINGOF THE FINALSECTION OF THIS WELL TO
IMPROVE DRILLINGEFFICIENCY,WELLBORE STABILITY ANDTO PROMOTE A GOOD CEMENT JOB OF THE
PRODUCTION CASING. ATTACHED IS A DRILLINGPLAN, WELLBORE DIAGRAM, DRILLING FLUID PROPOSAL
AND A PROPOSAL FOR PROCESSING AND DISPOSAL OF THE OIL BASE MUD.
QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY IS REQUESTS PERMISSION TO MODIFY THE PAD LAYOUT
IN ORDER TO ACCOMMODATETHE LARGER DRILLINGRIG. A REVISED LOCATION LAYOUTIS ATTACHED.

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY IS REQUESTING TO CHANGE THE WELL NAME FROM
RW 34-34AMUTO RW 34-34AD.

FOR TECHNICALQUESTIONS, PLEASE CONTACT JIM DAVIDSON, CHIEF DRILLINGENGINEER FOR QEP, AT
(303) 308-3090.
14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/ ed Title

Jan Nels Regulatory Affairs
Signature Date

September 12, 2007
THIS SPACEFOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval ofthis notice does not warrant or certify Office
that the applicantholds legal or equitabletitle to those rights in the subject lease which would
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency Init f e, dus or

fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

«nstrucaonsonreverse) DIV OF OIL,GAS & *



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth
Uinta Surface
Green River 3,276'
Wasatch 6,526'
Mesaverde 9,276'
Sego l1,601'
Castlegate l1,756'
Blackhawk 12,111'
Mancos Shale 12,570'
Mancos B 12,985'
Frontier 15,866'
Dakota Silt 16,778'
Dakota 16,988'
Morrison 17,478'
TD 17,725'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas. Or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 6,526'
Gas Mesaverde 9,276'
Gas Blackhawk 12,11l'
Gas Mancos Shale 12,570'
Gas Mancos B 12,985'
Gas Dakota



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected, samples will
be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be
obtained from Wonsits Valley water right # A36125 (which was filed on May 7, 1964,) or
Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined
by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before1989 is not
depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to supply fresh water for drilling purposes.
All water resulting from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash Central
Battery Disposal Site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site;
SWNW, Section 12, T8S, R21E.

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 13-5/8" 5000 psi double gate, 5,000 psi annular BOP (schematic included) from
surface hole to 7" casing point. A 13-5/8" 10,000 psi double and single gate may be
substituted based on contractor availability and substructure height of the drilling rig.

B. 11" or 13-5/8" 10,000 psi double gate, 10,000 psi single gate, 10,000 psi annular
BOP (schematic included) from 7" casing point to total depth. The choice of BOP
stacks is based on the drilling contractor's availability.

C. Functional test daily

D. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psi/foot or 1500 psi, whichever is
greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed the
internal yield pressure of the casing.

E. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure of
casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 10M system and individual components shall
be operable as



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

4. Casing Design:

Hole Csg. Top Bottom Wt. Grade Thread Cond.
Size Size (MD) (MD)

26" 20" sfc 40-60' Steel Cond. None Used
17-1/2" 13-3/8 sfc 500' 54.5 K-55 STC New

11" 9-5/8" sfc 8500' 47 HCP-110 SLU New '
II*

8-1/2" 7" 8100' 13,000' 29* HCP-l l0 LTC New
SDrift

6-1/8" 4-1/2" sfc 13,700' 15.1 P-110 LTC New

6-1/8" 4-1/2" 13,700' 17,475' 15.1 Q-125 LTC New
* Flush Joint

Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile
(minimum)

13-3/8" 54.5 lb. K-55 STC 1,130 psi 2,730 psi 547,000 lb.

9-5/8" 47 lb. HCP-110 LTC 7,100 psi 9,440 psi 1,213,000 lb.

7" 29 lb.* HCP-110 LTC 9,200 psi l1,220 psi 797,000 lb.

4-1/2" 15.1 lb. P-110 LTC 14,350 psi 14,420 psi 406,000 lb.

4-1/2" 15.1 lb. Q-125 LTC 15,840 psi 16,380 psi 438,000 lb.
* Special Drift

MINIMUM DESIGN FACTORS:

COLLAPSE: 1.125
BURST: 1.10
TENSION: 1.80

Area Fracture Gradient: 0.9 psilfoot
Maximum anticipated mud weight: 15.4 ppg
Maximum surface treating pressure: 12,500



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

5. Auxiliary Eauioment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - yes

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually and/or PVT/Flow Show

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Rotating Head - yes
If drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling
below 500').

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will
be used. Oil based drilling mud will be used to drill the final section of the hole. The
water based and oil based drilling system specifics are attached to this APD. Maximum
anticipated mud weight is 15.4 ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

6. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores - none anticipated

B. DST - none anticipated

C. Logging - Mud logging - 4500' to TD
GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density,



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

D. Formation and Completion Interval: Mancos interval, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation -- Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

7. Cementing Program

20" Conductor:
Cement to surface with construction cement.

13-3/8" Surface Casing: sfc - 500' (MD)
Slurry: 0' - 500'. 610 sxs (731 cu ft) Premium cement + 0.25 lbs/sk Flocele + 2% CaCl2
Slurry wt: 15.6 ppg, slurry yield: 1.20 ft3/sx, slurry volume: 17-1/2" hole + 100% excess.

9-5/8" Intermediate Casing: sfc - 8500' (MD)
Lead Slurry: 0' - 8,100'. 1208 sks (316 bbls) Foamed Lead 50/50 Poz cement + 0.1 %
FDP-C766-05 (Low Fluid Loss Control) + 5 #/sx Silicate Compacted + 20 % SSA-1 +

0.1 % Versaset + 1.5 % Zonesealant 2000 (Foamer) Slurry wt: 14.3 ppg, (unfoamed) or
11.0 ppg. (foamed) Slurry yield: 1.47 ft3/sk (unfoamed), Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 35
% excess.
Tail Slurry: 8,100' - 8,500'. 115 sks (30 bbls) Tail 50/50 Poz cement + 0.1 % FDP-
C766-05 (Low Fluid Loss Control) + 5 #/sx Silicate Compacted + 20 % SSA-1 + 0.1 %
Versaset Slurry wt: 14.3 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.47 ft3/sk, Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 35%
excess.

7" Intermediate Casing: 8,000 - 13,000' (MD)
Foamed Lead Slurry 2: 8,000' - 13,000'. 499 sks (792 cu ft) 50/50 Poz Premium + 20%
SSA-1 + 3 % silicalite compacted + 3% Silicalite Compacted + 0.5% Halad 344 + 0.2%
Halad 413 + 0.1% HR-12 + 0.7% Super CBL + 0.2% Suspend Slurry wt: 14.0 ppg,,
Slurry yield: 1.59 ft3/sk, Slurry volume: 8-1/2" hole + 25% excess.

4-1/2" Production Casing: sfc - 17,725' (MD)
Lead/Tail Slurry: 6,700 - 17,725'. 941 sks (1402 cu ft) Premium Cement + 17.5% SSA-

1, + 4% Microbond HT, + 0.2% Halad 344 + 0.5% Halad 413, + 0.3% CFR-3, + 0.9%
HR-12, + 0.2% Super CBL, + 0.2% Suspend HT, 17.5% SSA-2. Slurry wt: 16.2 ppg,
Slurry yield: 1.49 ft'/sk, Slurry volume: 6-1/8" hole + 35% in open hole



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface on the intermediate string and 5,000' on the production
string. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and across zones as required by
the authorized officer to insure protection of natural resources.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 13,000 psi. Maximum
anticipated bottom hole temperature is 305° F.

9. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR OIL BASE MUD:

A. See attached diagram of well pad layout. A reserve pit will be constructed for this
location. This pit will be constructed so that a minimum of two vertical feet of
freeboard exists above the top of the pit at all times and at least one-half of the
holding capacity will be below ground level. The pit will be lined with a synthetic
reinforced liner, 30 millimeters thick, with sufficient bedding used to cover any rocks
prior to putting any fluids into the pit. The pad will be designed so that runoff from
adjacent slopes does not flow into the reserve pit. The liner will overlap the pit walls
and be covered with dirt and/or rocks to hold it in place. At the beginning of drilling
operations this reserve pit will have an open-ended dike placed in the pit that allows
the fluids to migrate from one side of the pit to the other during the drilling of the
surface and intermediate hole using water based mud. At the time that operations
begin to drill the production hole with oil base mud, this dike will be extended,
dividing the pit into two distinct, isolated halves allowing no migration of fluids from
one side to the other. At that time all fluids will be removed from the end of the pit to
be used as a cuttings pit. This cuttings pit will be used for oil based cuttings
generated during drilling of the production hole.

B. Oil-base mud will be mixed in the closed circulating system and transferred to four
500-bbl tanks on location for storage prior to and after drilling operations. Drip pans
will be installed below the rotary beams on the substructure and can be viewed on site
from the cellar area. As the production section of the hole is drilled, the cuttings
transported to the surface with the drilling fluid will be mechanically separated from
the drilling fluid as waste by two shale-shakers and then cleaned/dried via a mud
cleaner and/or centrifuge. These separated cuttings will be collected in a steel catch
tank once they leave the closed circulating system and transported and placed into the
cuttings half of the reserve



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

C. Plastic material will underlay the rig, oil base mud/diesel storage tanks and mud pits.
All tanks on location will be placed inside of berms. Any oily waste fluids and
sediments generated at the work site during drilling operations or when cleaning the
fluid containment system after drilling will also be placed into the cuttings half of the
pit.

D. All rig ditches will be lined and directed to a lined sump for fluid recovery. A drip
pan will be installed on the BOP stack, a mud bucket will be utilized as needed on
connections and a vacuum system will be used on the rig floor for fluid recovery in
those areas.

E. Once all waste has been placed in the cuttings portion of the pit and all necessary
approvals obtained, the oilfield waste management consultant Soli-Bond or a similar
company will mobilize equipment and personnel to the site to perform the cement
based solidification/stabilization process in-situ for encapsulation. Soil will be
backfilled over the processed material used on the cuttings side of the pit and that
portion of the pit area will be returned to the existing grade bordering the pit. Please
see the attached Soli-Bond Proposal for Processing and Disposal of Drilling Waste
for specific details. The half of the reserve pit containing water base materials will be
left to evaporate and will be closed and reclaimed at the time that portion of the pit is



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, CO.
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

BOP Requirements:

1133-55/8"5RMSa

ce

Sapdool

13-5/8" 10M Annular

13-5/8" 10M Double Ram

13-5/8" 10M Mud Cross

2" KillLine 3" Choke Line

13-5/8" 10M Single Ram

I I

13-5 8" 5M x 13 5/8" 10 ut -Bowl

Mat Board

13-5/8" SM "A" Section

QEP / Wexpro

13-3/8" 54.5# K55 Casing
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RW 34-34 AD

20" Conductor CSA 40-60'

AIR Drilled

3-3/8" 54.5# K-55 CSA 500'

Green River @3276'

Light KCL - Gel System
for Inhibition

7" IIner top 500' above 9-5/8" casing shoe

9-5/8" 47# HCP-110 Flush Jnt CSA 6300'

Wasatch @6526'

Mesaverde @9276'

Mud: Polymer System
Sego @11,601'

Castlegate @11,756'

Blackhawk @12,111'

Mancos Shale @12,570'
7" 26# & 29# special Drift for 6-1/8"
HCP-110 CSA 13,000' +I- (case off at least the Mancos Top)

Mancos "B" @12,986'

e Mud-OBM

Frontler @15,866'

Dakota @16,988'

Morrison @17,478'

4-1/2" 15.1 # HCP-110 & Q-125
CSA
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Project Summary ~• "2•?-
Se: 34-T7S-R22E

Uinith, County Utah

Depth Formations interval Comments MucI Mud Properties
(ft) | Weight

(ppg)

llale size• 17 II2""I Caning: 13 3/8" NA NA
Uinta

AIR DRILLED
500' Surface T.D.

KCLINew PHPA 8.6 Vis (sec/qi): 28-40
Hele size: 11 IP/ Casirig: 9 5/8" Flish Joim

PV (cp): 0 12
.

Drillout with water, adding KCL for 2·3%. Pump pre.
3,276' Green RiveT hydmted NewGel sweeps for hole cleaning. For seepage,

Mahogeny incorporate Hne I..CM Into the NewGel sweeps. gg
Begin mud up operadons at +/- 5600ft or beFore drilling into FL (ml/30 min): 8-10
the Wasutch.
R Is recommended to have tile KCL % st 3.0 or > before
drilling into the Wasatch IÁN °/o 3-5
Mairrtain the iluid loss at 8 mis with AquaBiociNewPac.
Maintain theology control wRh NewEdge, CFL II, and ME 10.0- 03DrillThin
Maintain hardness at 100 mgli or > with IlmelGyp additions.

6,300' Intermediate As sempage Is encountered, pump LCM sweeps as condi- 9.5 CI (my/I): I I-15K

T.D• -t T.D is expected to be in the 5.4-8.5 ppg range KCL %: 2.5-3.0

6.526' Wasatch NenPHPA 9..8 Vis (seciqi): Joas
9,276' Mesa Verde IInte en. 8 vi I,iner: 7 "

PV (cp) : 12-20
Onil out, running fresh water comider maintaining the KCL at 3
% urtil the Meea Verde top at 9,967 10.4

I I,60 I ' Sego Maintain properties as recommended and increasing the PHPA VP (#s/l00ft') : 10-12
concentration to 1 0 ppb

Buck tongue Lost circulation may be a problem in this interval If lost circula- I E·4 FL (ml/30 min): 6-8
tion is encountered, ptrnp LCM pills as needed If LCM pills will
not control \œses, by-pass the sheltere and increase the LCMl 1,756 Castlegate concentratton in the system as needed 11• I GS ¾: 3-5

12,111' Blackhawk If severe lost circulation is encountered, consider a DynaPlug
sqlmeze pll: 10.0-10 5
Hole imtability may be encountered in the Mesa Verde Monitor

12,570' Mancos Shale torque, pump pressure, connection fill, and inp conditions for 13.5
indications of hole instatility and consider adding Asphalt if hele Cl (mg/l): 11-15K
conditions dictate13,000'+/- Liner T.D. 13.5

KCL %: 0

OptiDrill OBM PV (ep): 25-35
Hole sire: 7 0""/ ( ûsing. -I-l/2"' (3 §

12,985 Mancos B
Drill out with the OpdDrBI system, treating cement contami- VP (IbanOUW): 8-10
naiion as needed with OpilWei Lo prevent shaker blinding

HPHT (niisco anin.) :<20

Maintain hole cleaning during high ROP's with high viscosity
sweeps Use a 1:1 ratio of OpdVia RM and OpilVin. O/W : 80:20 - 85:15

15,866 Frontier equiv CO2 in the gas stream while drilling under balanced will re-
Dakota Sill quire additional Lims, smulsificra and wetling agent ES: 50tB-

16,988 Dakota
Maintain mud weight as needed foi meliconirol. Spui high I,ime: 2-4 ppb
meighi ECD pills for trips, legs, and e.ising

17,725 Total Depth ,,,,,¡,,,, 15.5
LGS%:<6

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Questar

P • Exploration & Producdonroject Summary RW34-34AD
Sec 34·T7S-R22E

Uintah, County Utah

DRILLINGFLUID PROPERTIES
Surface Hole: Air Drilled

Hole TVD Mud Plastic Yield API Total
Size (It) Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss Solids
(in) (ppg) (cp) (Ibl100ft") (mlI30min) (%)

17 1/2 " 0-500' NA NA MA NA NA

Intermediate Hole: KCL Water NewGel Sweeps - KCUPHPA
Hole MD Mud Plastic Yield API KCL LGS
Size (ft) Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss (%) Solids
(in) (ppg) (cp) (Ib/100ft") (mlI30min)

11" 500-5,500' 8 5-8 6 NA NA NA 2-3 < 1%

11 ' 5,500'-6,300' 8 6-9 4 8-12 10-12 8-10 3 O 3-6

Liner Interval: NewPHPA
Hole MD Mud Plastic Yield API MCL LGS
Size (It) Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss (%) Solids
(in) (ppg) (cp) (Ibl100ft") (mlI30min)

8 1/2" 6,300'-9,987 9 5-10 0 8-12 10-12 6-8 30 3-6

8 1/2 " 9,96T-13,000' 13 0-13 5 15-25 1 15 6-4 0 3-6

Production Interval: OotiDrill OBM
Hole MD Mud Plastic Yield OIW HPHT CaCL Electrical LGS
size (ft) weight Viscosity Point Ratio Fluid LOSS (mg/I) Stability Solids
(in) (ppg) (cp) (Ibl100ft") (%) (mlI30min) lo coa

(mv) (%)

7 O" 13,000 -17,725' 15 0-15 5 25-35 8-12 85/15 12-15 250-350 500 + 3-6

• Drillingfluid properties are guidelines only.
• Mud weights for guidelines only, allow hole conditions to dictate actual mud weights.
• Hole conditions should be closely monitored and product mix adjusted accordingly.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17Ih Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Questar
Inte rmed iate IntervaI aptor.non a moeuce..
11" Hole (500'- 6,300') g,Rc 4T7

2E
UIntah, County Utah

Intermediate Interval Drilling Fluid Properties
Depth Mud Viscosity Plastic Yield pH API Hardness Low KCL

Interval Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss Gravity
(TVD) (ppg) (sec/qt) (cp) (Ibl100ft") (mil30min) Mg/l) Solids %

500'-5,500' 8.5-8.6 27-28 NA NA 10.0-10.5 NA 100+ < 1.0 2.0-3.0

5,500'-6,300' 9.0-9.5 38-45 10-15 8-12 10.0-10.5 8-10 100+ 3-6 3.0+

• Drill out mixing KCL for 3%. Pump pre-hydrated NewGel sweeps for additional hole cleaning and as hole conditions dic-
tate. Add LCM to the sweeps for seepage.

• Mud up at 5,500 ft + to a KCL/Polymer system with properties as outlined above.

• If seepage is encountered, pump LCM sweeps as needed.
• Before drilling into the Wasatch, increase the KCL concentration to 3% or better.
• If Trona water is encountered, treat with Lime as needed for a 10.2 pH and 100 mg/l hardness.
• Mud weight at Intermediate T.D. is expected to be in the 9.2-9.4 ppg range.

Challenges: Strategies:
Use New Ease 203 (1-2 gal. down the drill pipe on connections)

Bit Balling SAPP and Soap Sticks to prevent balling and to increase penetra-
tion rates.

Ifwater flows become excessive, mud up and increase mud weight
Water Flows (Trona) as needed for control. Treat carbonate contamination with Lime/

Calcium Chloride as needed.

For seepage pump 50 bbi sweeps with 5-10 ppb DynaFiber and 10-
20 ppb NewCarb as needed. For partial or totallosses pump
sweeps with 10-15 ppb FiberSeal and Cedar Fiber. Iflosses are

Lost Circulation not controlled with sweeps consider 10-15% LCMin active system.
Iflosses are severe the use of a DynaPlug Squeeze is strongly
recommended.

Maintain mud weight as low as possible. Control Low Gravity Solids
Differential Sticking below 6%, and control fluid loss at 8-10 mis/30 min.

Pump 20-40 bbl. Sweeps with NewEase 203, New100N, DynaDet,
Increase ROP with PDC Bits and SAPP. (FlexDrillSweeps)

Hole Instability/Sloughing Shale Co1nsideprbadditionsof Asphalt at 4-6 ppb and/or Potassium Silicate

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(305) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Intermediate Interval Ex¢oradonue roduc#on

11" Hole (500'- 6,300') RW34-34AD
Sec 34-T7S-R22E

Ulntah, County Utah

Offset Data:
Some wells in this area have experienced losses in the Green River and Wasatch formations. LCMsweeps are strongly
recommended for this reason. Mud weights should be keep as low as practical but increases to 9.5 ppg may be required
to control the Trona Water flows which can be encountered from 3,000-4,000'.

Fluid Recommendations:
• Drillout cement, float collar and new formation. Test the integrity of the casing seat and squeeze if necessary.
• Close in pits and begin additions of KCL, building to 3% . Maintain 3% KCL throughoutthe interval.
• If a Trona Water flow is encountered additions of Lime and/or Calcium Chloride should be used to adjust alka-

linities as needed. An increase of mud weight to 9.5 may be necessary to control water flows in this area.
• The use of a premix tank is highly recommended. Pre-Hydrate NewGel for use as sweeps and for viscosity

when a mud up is started at +/- 5,500'. Fill premix tankwith fresh water. Treat out hardness with SodaAsh as
needed. Add 0.25-0.5 ppb Caustic Soda for a 10.0-10.5 pH. Begin additions of 20-25 ppb NewGel allow suf-
ficient circulating time for maximum hydration. Add 1.0-2.0 ppb CFL II. Then mix additional NewGel (30-40
ppb total)or a 120+ funnel viscosity. The pre-hydrated bentonite can be pumped from the premix to the pill
tank and pumped downhole for sweeps or can be added slowly to the 3% KCL water for viscosity and rheology
control.

• At 5,500'-6,000' (before intermediate T.D.) begin a mud up. Add pre-hydrated NewGel from the premix tank to
the active system to increase funnel viscosity to 35-40 sec/qt. Maintain viscosity with pre-hydrated NewGel as
needed. The system should be monitored and additions of KCL be adjusted to maintain 3% KCL.

• Rheology can be enhanced with additions of .25-1.0 ppb Flowzan as needed.
• Reduce Fluid Loss to 8-10CC/30min with additions of 0.5-1.0 ppb NewPAC and/or 2-4 ppb Aqua Bloc by

5,500'and lower to 6-8 CC/30min prior to TD at 11,900'.
• If penetration rates slow sweeps with New 100N, NewEase 203, SAPP, and DynaDet should be considered.

(1% New 100N, 1% NewEase 203, 0.SA).75 ppb SAPP, 0.2 % DynaDet). "Flex Sweeps"
• If an increase in mud weight is necessary seepage and/or lost circulation may become a problem. For seepage

pump 20-30 bbl pills containing a combination of NewCarb and DynaFiber mixed at a 2:1 ratio.
• If losses become severe, LCM sweeps of Cedar Fiber and FiberSeal should be considered and incorporated

into the system as needed. If losses continue, increase coarse LCM in active system to 15-20%. If losses con-
tinuethe use of a DynaPlug Squeeze is strongly recommended.

• At TD increase funnel viscosity for logs and casing operations as hole conditions dictate. Suggest funnel vis-
cosity be increased to 45-50 sec/qt, before logging operations be attempted.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Liner Interval Ex¢oradonue roducQon

8 1/2" Hole (6,300'-13,000') RWs4-34AD
Sec 34-T7S-R22E

UInfah, County Utah

Liner Interval Drilling Fluid Properties
Depth Mud Viscosity Plastic Yield pH API Hardness Low

Interval Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss Gravity
(TVD) (ppg) (sec/qt) (cp) (Ibl100ff) (mlI30min) Mg/1) Solids

6,300'-13,000' 13.5-14.0 40-50 18-25 10-15 10.0-10.5 6-8 100+ 3-6

• After drilling out, consider continuing additions of KCL until drilling into the Mesa Verde at 9,967' +/-. After drilling
into the Mesa Verde , allow the system to revert to a fresh water polymer system.

• As mud weight is increased, seepage losses can become severe. Treat with LCM pills as needed. If pill treatments will
not contain the losses at reasonable levels, by-pass the shakers, retaining the pills and allowing the LCM concentration
to increase as needed.

• Hole instability can occur in the Mesa Verde in this area. If encountered, consider adding Asphalt, building to a 4-6 ppb
concentration.

• High pressure may be encountered in the Castlegate/Blackhawk. Monitor closely for increased pressure while drilling
and use caution on trips to minimize possible swabbing.

• Mud weight at Liner Interval T.D. is expected to be in the 12.0-12.5 ppg range.

Challenges: Strategies:

Hole Instability/Sloughing Shale Consider 4-6 ppb Asphalt

Monitor well conditions and increase density as needed
Increase in Formation pressure with NewBar as needed.

As mud weight is increased (10.0ppg +) seepage and
losses may become a problem. For seepage pump 50
bbi sweeps with 5-10 ppb DynaFiber and 10-20 ppb
NewCarb as needed. For partial or totallosses pump
sweeps with 10-15 ppb FiberSeal and Cedar Fiber.

Seepage/Lost Circulation Severity of losses will determine size and quantity of
LCMadded. If losses are not controlled with sweeps
consider 10-15% LCMin active system. For severe
losses the use of a DynaPlug squeeze should be con-
sidered.

Maintain mud weight as low as possible. Control Low
Differential Sticking Gravity Solids below 6%, and control fluid loss at 8-10

mis/30 min.

Pump 20-40 bbl. Sweeps with NewEase 203, Newi00N,
Increase ROP with PDC Bits DynaDet, and SAPP. (FlexDrillSweeps)

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Liner Interval *"''*
Exploration & Produc&on

8 1/2" Hole (6,300'-13,000') RW34-34AD
Sec 34-T7S-R22E

UInfats, County Utair

Offset Data:
Wells in this area have experienced losses as mud weights are increased to control formation pressure. LCMsweeps are
strongly recommended for this reason. Mud weights should be keep as low as practical but increases to 12.5 ppg may be
required by Liner TD at 13,000'.

Fluid Recommendations:

• Drillout cement, iloat collar and new formation with the system from the previous interval. Test the integrity of
the casing seat and squeeze if necessary.

• Consider continuing additions of KCL until drilling into the Mesa Verde at 9,967+/-. Allow KCL to naturally
dissipate by dilution with fresh water. Begin additions of 0.5-1.0 ppb NewPHPA and maintain throughout the
interval.

• Maintain viscosity with PreHydrated NewGel until chlorides have dropped below 5000-7000 mg/I. After chlo-
rides have dropped NewGel willnot need to be pre-hydrated and can be added directly to the system.

• Begin additions of NewPHPA. Concentration of NewPHPA should be maintained at 0.5-1.0 ppb throughoutthe
interval. As mud weight increases additions of PHPA should be switched from NewPHPA DLMW to the shorter
chain NewPHPA DSL.

• If hole conditions dictate, consider 4-6 ppb Asphalt.
• If penetration rates slow sweeps with New 100N, NewEase 203, SAPP, and DynaDet should be considered.

(1% New 100N, 1% NewEase 203, 0.5-0.75 ppb SAPP, 0.2% DynaDet)."Flex Sweeps"
• Increase mud weight as needed to control formation pressures as needed. Mud weights should be maintained

as low as practical to reduce chance of losses and differential sticking. Increase mud weightas needed with
NewBar.

• As density increases additions of NewEdge and/or DrillThin should be added for rheology control.
• As bottom hole temperatures increase and additional fluid loss control is desired supplement the NewPAC with

DynaPlex for fluid loss control Lower API filtrate to6-8 cc's with additions of NewPAC and DynaPlex.
• As mud weight is increased seepage and/or lost circulation may become a problem. For seepage pump 20-30

bbl pills containing a combination of NewCarb and DynaFiber mixed at a 2:1 ratio. If partial or total retums are
encountered, LCM sweeps with a varied size distribution including Cedar Fiber and Fiber Seal, PhenoSeal
and other assorted sizes should be considered and incorporated into the system as needed. 20-25% LCM in
the active system may be required. The type, size and quantity of LCM used will depend on the severity of
losses. If losses are severe a DynaPlug squeeze should be considered.

• At TD increase funnel viscosity for logs and casing operations as hole conditions dictate. Suggest funnel vis-
cosity be increased to 50-55 sec/qt, before logging or casing operations be attempted.

• While circulating casing it is recommended to reduce Yield Points for cementing operations.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2206 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Production Interval Ergorau n
farroduc&on

6 1/8" Hole (13,000'-17,725') RW34-34AD
Sec 34-TIS-R22E

UIntah, County Utah

Production Interval Drilling Fluid Properties
Depth Mud Plastic Yield O/W HTHP Excess Electrical Low CaCl

Interval Weight Viscosity Point Ratio Fluid Loss Lime Stability Gravity Mg/l
(TVD) (ppg) (cp) (Ibl100ft=) % (mlI30min) (PPB) (MV) Solids Water

13,000'-17,725' 15.0-15.5 25-35 8-10 85:15 12-15 2-4 500+ < 6 300K

Drilling Fluid Recommendations: (13,000'-17,725')
• Displace to a OptiDrill OBM after finishing the liner job at 13,300'.
• After displacement, maintain the OptiDrill system within the parameters outlined above.
• Offsets in the area have encountered high rates of seepage in this interval. If indications of seepage are observed,

sweeps of NewCarb C, Dynafiber C & M, NewSeal, and CyberSeal are recommended. Mixing ratios are recom-

mended to be at 5:1 NewCarb M to DynaFiber , NewSeal, and CyberSeal. If losses continue to be a problem, con-
sider trying different sizes and combinations until ssepage is slowed.

• Maintain rheology low to reduce ECD values and reduce surge and swab during connections and trips.
• Drill as underbalanced as possible to help prevent losses and increase penetration rates.
• For pressure control, spot high weight pills with an equivalent mud weight to drilling ECD's. On trips in, stage these

pills out and divert to storage for further use. High weight pills in excess of the drilling ECD should be avoided due to
possible lost circulation.

Challenges Strategies

Displacement • Have 1200-1300 bbls of OBM volume on location along with a pump capable of keeping up
with displacement rates.

• Pump a 10-20 bbl viscosified OBM spacer ahead of the OpyiDrill (enough for 500 ft + sepa-

ration)
• A steady pump rate for either turbulentor plug flow should be used. Reciprocate and rotate

to assist in minimizing channeling.
• Do not shut down once displacementcommences.
• Should any contamination occur, isolate the contaminated fluid for reconditioning.

Seepage/lost Circulation. Pump LCM sweeps when seepage and/or losses are indicated. Sweeps should be a mixture of ,

NewCarb, DynaFiber, NewSeal, and CyberSeal. If lost returns are encountered, consider a Di-
aseal M or cross linked polymer squeeze.

Maintaining Oil wet solids For every 1.0 ppg mud weight increase, mix 0.02 gal/bbl OptiWet

Pressure control • Spot weighted pills calculated to give a bottom hole pressure equal to drilling ECD.
• Do not exceed drillingbottom hole pressure with the ECD pill. Lost circulation has been a

problem on offset wells.
• Stage weighted pills out of the hole and recover for future use.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(803) 623-2206 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Production IntervaI aptor.n.."ÍÁoeuce.n
6 1/8" Hole (13,000'-17,725') RW34-34AD

Sec 34-T7S-R22E
UInfah, County Utah

Maintenance Procedure:

HPHT - Maintain HPHT values within programmed parameters. Additions of OptiMul and OptiPlus, at recommended
concentrations should maintain the HTHP at recommended levels. If hole conditions indicate a need for lower HPHT
values, Opti G at 2-4 ppb is recommended.

Elechical Stability- Electrical stability should be used as a guide not as an absolute in determining maintenance require-

ments. Actual values are not critical but should be observed for trends or changes. Decreases in electrical stability
should be noted along with other mud properties to determine treatments.To increase electrical stability add emulsifi-
ers and wetting agents OptiMul and OptiPlus or decrease water content.

OiPWater Ratio - Maintain the oil/water ratio in the 90:10-80:20 range depending on mud weight and condition.. Higher
water content will decrease the amount of OptiVis needed for rheology.

Mud weight - Maintain minimum fluid densities with solids equipment. Monitor hole conditions and all drilling parame-
ters closely for indications of increases in formation pressures and adjust fluid densities accordingly. Drilling with a
minimum amount of overbalance will reduce the possibility of losing returns and/or of differentially sticking the drill
string. Mud weight on offset wells was in the 15.0-15.5 ppg range at T.D.

Rheology - Maintain solids as low as possible. Increase rheology as needed for hole cleaning with a combination of
OptiVis (Bentone 910) and Opti Vis RM or Opti Vis PS and water content.

Lime - Maintain the excess Lime at 2-3 ppb excess.

Hole cleaning - Calculate rheology requirements based on ROP, pump rates and hole conditions. Adjust as needed .

Mud losses downhole-Monitor ECD's with Hy-Calc, maintaining the lowest values possible. If losses are encountered;
sweeps containing NewCarb, DynaFiber, Opti-G, and NewSeal should be circulated to aid in the prevention of
losses. If seepage losses continue and/or become severe, consider spotting a pill with Magma Fiber (Fine & Regu-
lar) and the above formulation. Keep the hole full at all times, and avoid excessive swabbing and/or surge actions
when tripping.

Soßds Control- Maintain low gravity solids at 4-6 % by volume. The high performance shakers should be equipped with
the finest mesh screens that will handle the circulating volume and not cut barite out.

Water Contandnation- Keep all water sources off the mud pits. If contamination occurs, treat with emulsifiers and Cal-
cium Chloride as needed.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 480
Denver, CO. 80202
(305) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Production Interval ©"•"•'
E×pforation & Producdon

6 1/8" Hole (13,000'-17,725') RWag.34ap
Sec 34-T7S-R22E

Uinfah, County Utah

Recommended materials for relaxed filtrate OptiDrill system :

( 85:15 OiPWater Ratio)

Product Function Concentration

MNvR.x Weighting material As needed

Opif Wa Organophilic Clay / Viscosifier 2-4 ppb

opuMUJ Primary Emulsifier 2.0 ppb

oµHRins Secondary Emulsifier 4 0 gallbbl.

Opl Wr RM Low End Rheology Modifier 0.1-0.2 ppb

Calciurn Chloride Water Internal Phase 10 0%-20 0 % by volume

Calchun Ghkerirfri Salinity/Activity 300,000 -350,000 mg/I

OptiG Fluid Loss control Additive 1 0-4.0 ppb

Ume Alkalinity Additive 5 ppb

Newed) M Loss Circulation Material 10.0 ppb

NewC.wh F Loss Circulation Material As required

Dyn..iFiler Loss Circulation Material As required

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Streel, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(3G3) 023-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



SOLI-BOND.

OILFIELD WASTE MANAGEMENT PROPOSAL
For

QuestarMarket Resources

SOLI-BONDo Processing and Disposal of Drilling Waste
Batch Treatment

Wells: RWU 34-34AD
Section 34

T7S - R22E
Uintah County, Utah

Prepared For: Jon Gent
Region Drilling Manager
QuestarMarket Resources
1050 17 Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265
(303) 672-6927

Prepared By: Robert J. Wilson
Technical Sales Representative
Soli-Bond, Inc.
(303) 579-9800

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE:
Unless otherwise indicated or obvious from the Proposal, the information contained in this
Proposal is privileged and confidential, intended for the use of the individual or entity named
above. Dissemination, distribution or copying of this document is strictly prohibited.
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SOLI-BONDo Processing and Disposal of Drilling Waste
BATCH TREATMENT

QUESTAR e RW 34-27ADR
Uintah County, Utah

OVERVIEW

Soli-Bond, Inc. (SBI) proposes to utilize the SOLI-BONDo Process for the treatment of Drilling
Waste on the RW-34-34AD in Uintah County, Utah, which will be followed by onsite disposal
of the processed material.

This proposal will serve to delineate the specifications and criteria for achieving the project
objectives as required by Questar Market Resources (Client) and the appropriate regulatory
entities.

GENERAL DESCRIPTION OF THE SOLI-BOND® PROCESS

The SOLI-BONDo Process involves the controlled addition of a non-toxic, chemically reactive,
portland-cement-based reagent or reagents to a waste, followed by the mixing of the reagent with
the waste to form homogeneous slurry similar to viscous mortar. Oily substances that may be
present in the waste are broken up into small droplets or particles and dispersed throughout the
reagent/waste mixture during the mixing phase of the process. After the mixing phase, an
irreversible chemical reaction begins to occur between the reagent and water present (or added) in
the waste, ultimately causing the reagent/waste mixture to be transformed into a solid granular
material with a "soil-like" consistency, typically within 48 hours after processing. Any dispersed
particles of oily substances within the processed material are physically locked in place or
"micro-encapsulated" in their isolated state inside the reacted cementious matrix, preventing them
from re-coalescing and suddenly being released to the environment at significant rates. The same
irreversible reaction chemically stabilizes various metals that may be present in the waste,
primarily by transforming them into less soluble metal hydroxides and other chemical species,
thus greatly reducing their mobility and availability to the surrounding environment as well.
In summary The SOLI-BONDo Process reduces the leaching rate of target constituents of
concern from a waste form to such a degree that they can no longer cause harm to health or the
environment. The SOLI-BONDo Process is a waste treatmentmethod more generally known as
Solidification/Stabilization (S/S). S/S has been recognized and prescribed by the United States
Environmental Protection Agency for many years as an effective technology for the treatment of
waste containing various metals as well as non-volatile and semi-volatile organic substances.

INNOCUOUS WASTEAPPLICATIONS

The SOLI-BONDo Process can also be applied to solidify innocuous oilfield wastes such as spent
water based drilling fluids and physically unstable water based drill cuttings to avoid the
increased difficulties typically associated with the disposal of liquid or semi-solid wastes.
Irreversibly transforming the physical properties of an innocuous waste, from a liquid or semi-
solid state that's structurally unstable, into a solid, granular material with load bearing capability,
can be the sole reason for using The SOLI-BONDo Process. In addition, the chemically driven
transformation into a dry solid occurs quickly, with minimal volume addition and the process can
accommodate waste with high fluid content. For oilfield waste pit applications, the process
provides more rapid solidification of the pit contents, more room for the prescribed depth of soil
cover and can greatly reduce the waiting period for the pit contents to dry sufficiently for pit
closure as opposed to that required for conventional closure methods.
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SOLI-BONDe Processing and Disposal of Drilling Waste
BATCH TREATMENT

QUESTAR e RW 34-27ADR
Uintah County, Utah

SITE AND APPLICATION DESCRIPTION

The subject work site is an area constructed for the drilling and production of the gas well
covered in this proposal. The well plan contemplates the use of an oilbase drilling fluid during the
drilling of the production section of the well. As this section of the well is drilled, cuttings will be
generated, transported to the surface within the drilling fluid, then mechanically separated from
the drilling fluid as waste. These separated cuttings are expected to contain elevated levels of
adhered/absorbed hydrocarbons due to their prior contact with the oilbase drilling fluid. These
"oilbase cuttings" will be collected in steel catch tanks provided by the Client as drilling
progresses and then placed in the separate oil base cuttings pit.

In addition to the "oilbase cuttings" described above, oily waste fluids and sediments may be
generated at the work site during drilling operations and after drilling is completed the drilling
fluid containment system will be cleaned thus generating some oily cleaning waste as well. It is
these oilbase cuttings, waste fluids and sediments and cleaning waste that comprise all the waste
to be treatedand disposed of under this proposal.
Based on Client information and allowing for well bore washout, decompression/expansion of the
drilled cuttings and the adheredlabsorbed drilling fluids ("WEF"), the total volume of waste to
treat was estimated as follows:

RWU 34-34AD
4,725 feet of 6.125 inch diameter hole x WEF factor of 3: 517
Estimated additional sediments and cleaning waste: 10.500

Total Estimated Barrels of Waste to Treat: 11,017

SBI proposes to apply the SOLI-BONDo Process to the oilbase cuttings and other indicated
waste from the well during drilling operations to achieve the following objectives:

• Permanently reduce the leaching rate of target constituents of concern from the treated
material to within prescribed limits.

• Irreversibly solidify the physically unstable waste to allow onsite disposal and support of
soil cover without subsidence.

• Accomplish treatment with minimal volume addition to minimize disposal cell size and
facilitate required minimum space for soil cover.

• Achieve rapid solidification of the waste to allow prompt final disposal.

PRELIMINARY ACTIVITIES

SBI personnel collected a sample of waste similar in characteristics to the waste to be generated
on the subject project. The waste sample was used to conduct bench scale SOLI-BONDo
processing, which has been carried out to determine effective reagent formulations, reagent/waste
mix ratios, pricing and other aspects of this proposal.

OPERATIONAL PLAN

SBI jobsite operations will be conducted as follows:
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SOLI-BONDe Processing and Disposal of Drilling Waste
BATCH TREATMENT

QUESTAR • RW 34-27ADR
Uintah County, Utah

. After drilling the oilbase section of the well, SBI will install the SOLI-BOND® Waste
Processing System at the well site. The "oilbase cuttings" will be treated "in-situ" in the
existing lined pit.

• SBI will mobilize personnel to the jobsite to process the waste that has accumulated in the
lined oil base cuttings pit.

• Upon arrival at the jobsite, the SBI Site Foreman will conduct a Jobsite Safety Assessment
with SBI crew, discussing all potential jobsite safety hazards, required personal safety gear
and accident avoidance and conduct safety meetings with SBI crew prior to each day's work
throughout the project.

• SBI and Client Representative will verify the volume of waste to treat in each batch prior to
process operations.

• SBI crew will then process the waste with the SOLI-BONDo Waste Processing System.

• Waste processing will be preformed during eight (8) hour daylight shifts. After daily onsite
process operations are completed SBI personnel will prepare a SBI field ticket for Client
Representative signature, indicating the volume of waste processed (in barrels).

• Components of The SOLI-BONDo Waste Processing System may remain at the jobsite until
all waste to treat has been processed.

• After all waste is processed from the well, a composite sample of the processed material will
be collected for laboratory analysis to verify that it complies with criteria under the section
herein entitled "Performance Criteria."

• SBI will utilize the existing lined pit as an on-site disposal cell sized to accommodate the
processed oilbase cuttings and four (4) feet of soil cover after final reclamation of the drill
site. Client has provided a plastic liner for the disposal cell, including installation. After
achievement of performance criteria is verified, SBI will backfill the cell to the adjacent
surface elevation thus constituting final disposal of the processed material. SBI will then de-
mobilize equipment and personnel thus concluding SBI's onsite operations.

• A SBI Waste Treatment and Disposal Report suitable for submittal to the appropriate
regulatory agencies will then be prepared documenting all pertinent aspects of the project and
will be submitted to the Client.

PERFORMANCE CRITERIA
The treated waste will comply with the following criteria:

1. Leachable Oil and Grease less than 10 mg/L.
2. Leachable Total Dissolved Solids to be less than 5000 mg/L and/or leachable salts below

acceptable site-specific guidelines.

Compliance with the performance criteria will be certified by an accredited testing laboratory
utilizing the appropriate tests as prescribed and will be documented in a final report submitted to
Client and the appropriate regulatory agencies as required.

SCHEDULE (All time/days are estimates and may change due to jobsite conditions)
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SOLI-BONDo Processing and Disposal of Drilling Waste
BATCH TREATMENT

QUE STAR • RW 34-27ADR
Uintah County, Utah

ITEM / SERVICE ESTIMATED
(Based on estimated 11,017 total barrels of waste to process) DAYS

Mobilization And Setup 1
Estimated SOLI-BONDo PWD Waste Processing System Rental Days 15
Process Material, Backfill Cell 12
Takedown and Demobilization 1

ITEMS FURNISHED with SOLI-BOND@ PWD Waste Processing System
Equipment

• SB-2-7 Processor
• SOLI-BONDo Reagent Storage Silo w/ Discharge Auger
• Back Hoe Loader
• Ancillary Equipment
• First Aid and Safety Equipment
• SBI Crew Transportation

Personnel
• SBI Site Foreman
• SBI Operator Material
• Fuel necessary to operate Soli-Bond's motorized equipment.

Miscellaneous
• SBI Equipment Cleaning.
• One Laboratory Analysis of Processed Material. (for parameters indicated herein)
• SBI Waste Treatment and Disposal Report.

CLIENT RESPONSIBILITY

• Client will provide SBI with a written work order or other Client recognized document to
contract SBI to perform the work as described herein.

• Client will provide SBI with a list of any Client requirements related to performing and being
compensated for the work described herein.

• Client will provide "all weather" ingress and egress to the site.
• Client will provide process add-mix water.
• Client agrees that delays or interruptions in SBI's work described herein caused by "Acts of

Nature" or events under the responsibility of the Client or Client contractors (excluding SBI
and it's contractors) may result in additional charges to Client.
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QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.T'7S, R22E, S. L.B. &M• Well location, RW #34-34 AD, located as ,

shown in the SW 1/4 SE 1/4 of Section 34,
S89'55'W - 5253.60' (G.L.O.) T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah ~

BASIS OF ELEVATION
BENCH MARK 20EAM LOCATEDIN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION
35, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE,
QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR,GEOLOGICALSURVEY.
SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKEDAS BEING 4697 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

1941 Brass Cap
0.J' High, Mound Nor stone,

3 4 * °"°

o o

SCALE

CERTIFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHATTHE ABOVE gMSW PARED FROMRW j'J4-J4 AD FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS ONSI R MY

Elev. Ungraded Ground = 5210'
sTER SIM KANNODWLEDATEAEND TO THE

1938 Brass Cap 1938 Brass Cop 1938 Brass Cap I U1.2° High, Mound 1.1' H/ph, Mound 0.4' High Mound EGI AT1 161 9T7S or stone, or stone, or ston." REVISED:08-28-07 S.L.
TE

TBS seç·56'25"W
- 2637.95' (Meas.) SB955'41"W - 2638.59' (Meas.) TyOF

UINTAH ÑfGINEERING & it
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

(435) 789-1017(NAD 83)LEGEND•
SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATEDRAWN:LATITUDE= 40°09'47.18" (40.163106)

1" = 1000' 12-13-04 01-03-05= 90 SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109 25'25.00" (109,423611) PARTY REFERENCES(NAD 27) D.A. T.C. D.R.B. G.L.O. PLAT= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE= 40°09'47.31" (40.163142) WEATHER FILEA = SECTION CORNERSLOCATED. LONGITUDE= 109°25'22.53" (109.422925) COLD QUESTAREXPLR. &



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. FIGURE #1
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

RW #34-34 AD SCALE: 1" = 60'
DATE: 08--28-07

SECTION 34, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M• Drawn By S.L.
Approx.

..

..-- 858 SLsto1c944' FE

175' Sta.

C-4.5' F-0.4
B. 213. 9 , E/. 209. 0

HOTE. Fill Slope
Elare Pit is to be located
a min. of 100' from the
Well Head.
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PIPE RACKS

I I I I
c-1.2' L C-1.0'

D El 210.6' c E/. 210.4'

o
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E/. 217 9'
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C-28.5' s ,

e stine /
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-> -- C-0.7 "" Droinoge ./ E/. 20J.8
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------- -- -- EI. 210.1'
----- -- -- - UCHT PLANT
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: I BOILER
WARR

- 6 -- 5 PUMP HOUSE
C TANK

Existing
Surface
Pipe/ine

Existing
--

Drainage

PROPANE
STORAGE .

C- J. J '

to. 0+00

NO 7ES: ""' Pro os.« ace*" C-15'

E/ev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Stake = 5210.4' " 2'2"

4' UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
E/N/SHED GRADEELEV AT LOC. STAKE = . 85 So. ß00 Best * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (436)



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD· /FICURE #2
^o TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR ' '

X-Section
il RW #34-34 ADScale

SECTION 34, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
1" = 50' 858' FSL 1944' FEL

DATE: 08-28-07
Drown By S.L

100' 75' 16010°

LOCAR S E

SM. 2+JO

, 100' 75' 160'
10

cur S M. 0+50

75' 160'

SM. 0+00

APPROX/MATE ACREAGES
* NO TE:

WELLS/TE O/SR/RÐANCE = ±J.78J ACRES F/LL QUANT/TY/NCLUDES
NOTE: PROPOSED ROSO = ±O.41J ACRES 5% FOR COMPACT/ON
Topsoll should not be TOTAL = ±4.196 ACRES
Stripped Below Finished
Grade on Substructure Area.

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = 17,710 Cu. Yds.

Topsoil & Pit Bockfill = 7,410 Cu. Yds.
CUT (1/2 Pit Vol.)
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 3, 170 Cu. Yds.

EXCESS UNBALANCE = 10,JOO Cu. Yds.
Rernaining Location = 20,980 Cu. Yds. (After Interirn Rehabilitation)

TOTALCUT = 24,150 CU.YDS.
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

FILL = 6, 440 CU.YDS. es s.. zoo z..e • vernas, ut.» exore • (was>



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. /FIGURE #3
INTERIMRECLAMATION PLAN FOR '

RW #34-34 AD SCALE: 1" = 60'
SECTION34, T7S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. DATE: 08-28-07

Drawn By. S.L.
858' FSL 1944' FEL

Production Tanks

om HEAD

Access
Road

INTERIMRECLAMATION UINTAH ENGINEERING LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435)
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Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(November 1994) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ÖrÌÀÊË

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTSON WELLS UTU-0558
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian,Allottee or TribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 31643 (APD) for such proposals.

N/A
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/orNo.8UBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Ofher instructfons on reverse slafà RED WASH UNIT

1 Typeof Well

Oil Well O Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Nameof Operator RW 34-34AD
QUESTAR EXPLORATION&PRODUCTION, CO. 9. API Well No.
3a. Addæss 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 43-047-36351
11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL,UT 84078 |435-781-4331 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea
4. Location of Wel1(Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or SurveyDescription) UNDESIGNATED
858' FSL 1944' FEL SWSE SECTION 34, T7S, R22E 11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH
12. CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOXES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT,OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
I Notice of Intent

[¯
Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) WaterShut-Off
Alter Casing FractureTreat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other
Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

FinalAbandonment Notice ( Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (cleariy state all partinent detais, including estimated stating date of any pmposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recouplete horizonialy, give subsurface locations and meamred and tmo vertical depths of an pertinent markers and zones
Anach the Bond under which Ihe work will be performed or provide ile Bond Na on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be fied within 30 days
Following coupleiion of the involved operations If the operation resuks is a multiple completion or recompletion in a new intaval, a Form 3160-4 shal be filed once
Testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shal be fHed only aner all requirements, including reclamation, have bem completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY(QEP) REQUEST PERMISSION TO CHANGE THE DRILLING
PLANTHATWAS APPROVED ON SEPTEMBER 13, 2007. THE MAJOR CHANGES ARE AS FOLLOWS.

ELIMINATETHE 7" LINERAND RUN 7" CASING BACKTO SURFACE
CHANGETHE HOLE SIZE FROM 11" FOR THE 9 5/8" CASING TO 12- 1/4,, epted by the
CHANGE BOTTOMHOLE PRESSURE TO 11,000 PSI. Vision exOil, GM and Min g
ATTACHEDIS A REVISED DRILLINGPLAN AND WELLBORE DIAGRAM.

FORRECORDOig
FOR TECHNICALQUESTIONS, PLEASE CONTACTJIM DAVIDSON,CHIEF DRILLINGENGINEER FOR QEP AT
(303) 308-3090.
14. I herebycertify that the foregoing is true and correct
Narne (Printed/T d) Title

si
nnatNels NReaulatorvAffairs

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATEU$IE
Approve Title Date

Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approval ofthis notice does not warrant or certify Office
that the applicantholdslegalor equi1abletitle to thoserights in the subjectleasewhich would
entitlethe applicant to conductoperationsthereon.

Title 18 U.S.C Section 1001, makes it a crimefor any person knowingly and willfully to rnaketo anydepartmentor agencyof the UnitedStatesany false, fictitiousor

CONFIDENTIAI.
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth
Uinta Surface
Green River 3,276'
Wasatch 6,526'
Mesaverde 9,276'
Sego l1,601'
Castlegate l1,756'
Blackhawk 12,11l'
Mancos Shale 12,570'
Mancos B 12,985'
Frontier 15,866'
Dakota Silt 16,778'
Dakota 16,988'
Morrison 17,478'
TD 17,725'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas. Or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 6,526'
Gas Mesaverde 9,276'
Gas Blackhawk 12,111'
Gas Mancos Shale 12,570'
Gas Mancos B 12,985'
Gas Dakota



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected, samples will
be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be
obtained from Wonsits Valley water right # A36125 (which was filed on May 7, 1964,) or
Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined
by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before1989 is not
depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to supply fresh water for drilling purposes.
All water resulting from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash Central
Battery Disposal Site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site;
SWNW, Section 12, TSS, R21E.

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 13-5/8" 5000 psi double gate, 5,000 psi annular BOP (schematic included) from
surface hole to 7" casing point. A 13-5/8" 10,000 psi double and single gate may be
substituted based on contractor availability and substructure height of the drilling rig.

B. 11" or 13-5/8" 10,000 psi double gate, 10,000 psi single gate, 10,000 psi annular
BOP (schematic included) from 7" casing point to total depth. The choice of BOP
stacks is based on the drilling contractor's availability.

C. Functional test daily

D. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psilfoot or 1500 psi, whichever is
greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed the
internal yield pressure of the casing.

E. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure of
casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 10M system and individual components shall
be operable as



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

4. Casing Design:

Hole Csg. Top Bottom Wt. Grade Thread Cond.
Size Size (MD) (MD)

26" 20" sfc 40-60' Steel Cond. None Used
17-1/2" 13-3/8 sfc 500' 54.5 K-55 STC New

12-1/4" 9-5/8" sfc 8500' 47 HCP-110 SLIJ New
II*

8-1/2" 7" sfc 9000' 26 HCP-110 LTC New

8-1/2" 7" 9000' 13,000' 29* HCP-110 LTC New
SDrift

6-1/8" 4-1/2" sfc 13,700' 15.1 P-110 LTC New

6-1/8" 4-1/2" 13,700' 17,475' 15.1 Q-125 LTC New
* Flush Joint

Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile
(minimum)

13-3/8" 54.5 lb. K-55 STC 1,130 psi 2,730 psi 547,000 lb.

9-5/8" 47 lb. HCP-110 LTC 7,100 psi 9,440 psi 1,213,000 lb.

7" 26 HCP-110 LTC 7,800 psi 9,950 psi 693,000 lb.

7" 29 lb.* HCP-110 LTC 9,200 psi l1,220 psi 797,000 lb.

4-1/2" 15.1 lb. P-110 LTC 14,350 psi 14,420psi 406,000 lb.

4-1/2" 15.1 lb. Q-125 LTC 15,840 psi 16,380 psi 438,000 lb.
* Special Drift

MINIMUM DESIGN FACTORS:

COLLAPSE: 1.125
BURST: 1.10
TENSION:



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

Area Fracture Gradient: 0.9 psilfoot
Maximum anticipated mud weight: 15.4 ppg
Maximum surfàce treating pressure: 12,500 psi

5. Auxiliary Eauioment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - yes

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually and/or PVT/Flow Show

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Rotating Head - yes
If drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling
below 500').

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will
be used. Oil based drilling mud will be used to drill the final section of the hole. The
water based and oil based drilling system specifics are attached to this APD. Maximum
anticipated mud weight is 15.4 ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

6. Testing, loggine and coring urogram

A. Cores - none anticipated

B. DST - none



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

C. Logging - Mud logging - 4500' to TD
GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density, FMI

D. Formation and Completion Interval: Mancos interval, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation - Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

7. Cementing Program

20" Conductor:
Cement to surface with construction cement.

13-3/8" Surface Casing: sfc - 500' (MD)
Slurry: 0' - 500'. 610 sxs (731 cu ft) Premium cement + 0.25 lbs/sk Flocele + 2% CaCl2
Slurry wt: 15.6 ppg, slurry yield: 1.20 ft*/sx, slurry volume: 17-1/2" hole + 100% excess.

9-5/8" Intermediate Casing: sfc - 6300' (MD)
Lead Slurry: 0' - 5,900. 1697 sks (444 bbls) Foamed Lead 50/50 Poz cement + 0.1 %
FDP-C766-05 (Low Fluid Loss Control) + 5 #/sx Silicate Compacted + 20 % SSA-1 +
0.1 % Versaset + 1.5 % Zonesealant 2000 (Foamer) Slurry wt: 14.3 ppg, (unfoamed) or
11.0 ppg. (foamed) Slurry yield: 1.47 ft3/sk (unfoamed), Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 35
% excess.
Tail Slurry: 5,900' - 6,300'. 115 sks (30 bbls) Tail 50/50 Poz cement + 0.1 % FDP-
C766-05 (Low Fluid Loss Control) + 5 #/sx Silicate Compacted + 20 % SSA-1 + 0.1 %
Versaset Slurry wt: 14.3 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.47 ft*/sk, Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 35%
excess.

7" Intermediate Casing: sfc - 13,000' (MD)
Foamed Lead Slurry 2: 5,500' - 13,000'. 748 sks (1189 cu ft) 50/50 Poz Premium +

20% SSA-1 + 3 % silicalite compacted + 3% Silicalite Compacted + 0.5% Halad 344 +

0.2% Halad 413 + 0.1% HR-12 + 0.7% Super CBL + 0.2% Suspend Slurry wt: 14.0 ppg,,
Slurry yield: 1.59 ft*/sk, Slurry volume: 8-1/2" hole + 25% excess.

4-1/2" Production Casing: sfc - 17,725' (MD)
Lead/Tail Slurry: 6,700 - 17,725'. 941 sks (1402 cu ft) Premium Cement + 17.5% SSA-
1, + 4% Microbond HT, + 0.2% Halad 344 + 0.5% Halad 413, + 0.3% CFR-3, + 0.9%
HR-12, + 0.2% Su er CBL, + 0.2% Suspend HT, 17.5% SSA-2. Slurry wt: 16.2 ppg,
Slurry yield: 1.49 ft /sk, Slurry volume: 6-1/8" hole + 35% in open hole



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface on the intermediate string and 5,000' on the production
string. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and across zones as required by
the authorized officer to insure protection of natural resources.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 11,000 psi based on P*
pressure data from wells completed in the Dakota. Maximum anticipated bottom hole
temperature is 305° F. A mud weight of 15 ppg is anticipated to be required based on hole
stability.

9. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR OIL BASE MUD:

A. See attached diagram of well pad layout. A reserve pit will be constructed for this
location. This pit will be constructed so that a minimum of two vertical feet of
freeboard exists above the top of the pit at all times and at least one-half of the
holding capacity will be below ground level. The pit will be lined with a synthetic
reinforced liner, 30 millimeters thick, with sufficient bedding used to cover any rocks
prior to putting any fluids into the pit. The pad will be designed so that runoff from
adjacent slopes does not flow into the reserve pit. The liner will overlap the pit walls
and be covered with dirt and/or rocks to hold it in place. At the beginning of drilling
operations this reserve pit will have an open-ended dike placed in the pit that allows
the fluids to migrate from one side of the pit to the other during the drilling of the
surface and intermediate hole using water based mud. At the time that operations
begin to drill the production hole with oil base mud, this dike will be extended,
dividing the pit into two distinct, isolated halves allowing no migration of fluids from
one side to the other. At that time all fluids will be removed from the end of the pit to
be used as a cuttings pit. This cuttings pit will be used for oil based cuttings
generated during drilling of the production hole.

B. Oil-base mud will be mixed in the closed circulating system and transferred to four
500-bbl tanks on location for storage prior to and after drilling operations. Drip pans
will be installed below the rotary beams on the substructure and can be viewed on site
from the cellar area. As the production section of the hole is drilled, the cuttings
transported to the surfàce with the drilling fluid will be mechanically separated from
the drilling fluid as waste by two shale-shakers and then cleaned/dried via a



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

cleaner and/or centrifuge. These separated cuttings will be collected in a steel catch
tank once they leave the closed circulating system and transported and placed into the
cuttings half of the reserve pit.

C. Plastic material will underlay the rig, oil base mud/diesel storage tanks and mud pits.
All tanks on location will be placed inside of berms. Any oily waste fluids and
sediments generated at the work site during drilling operations or when cleaning the
fluid containment system after drilling will also be placed into the cuttings half of the
pit.

D. All rig ditches will be lined and directed to a lined sump for fluid recovery. A drip
pan will be installed on the BOP stack, a mud bucket will be utilized as needed on
connections and a vacuum system will be used on the rig floor for fluid recovery in
those areas.

E. Once all waste has been placed in the cuttings portion of the pit and all necessary
approvals obtained, the oilfield waste management consultant Soli-Bond or a similar
company will mobilize equipment and personnel to the site to perform the cement
based solidification/stabilization process in-situ for encapsulation. Soil will be
backfilled over the processed material used on the cuttings side of the pit and that
portion of the pit area will be returned to the existing grade bordering the pit. Please
see the attached Soli-Bond Proposal for Processing and Disposal of Drilling Waste
for specific details. The half of the reserve pit containing water base materials will be
left to evaporate and will be closed and reclaimed at the time that portion of the pit is



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
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DRILLING PROGRAM

BOP Requirements:

-

5RMSa eSapd

13-5/8" 10M Annular

13-5/8" 10M Double Ram

13-5/8" 10M Mud Cross

2" KillLine 3" Choke Line

13-5/8" 10M Single Ram

G.L. G.L.

13-5/8" 5M x 13 5/8" 10

ua Mat Board

13-5/8" 5M "A" Section

QEP / Wexpro

13-3/8" 54.5# K55 Casing



REMOTELYOPERATED CHOKE '

REMOTELY OPERATEDVALVF 3"
. 4

J•
ACUUSTABLECHOKE J r

SEQUENCE OPTIONAL

oausTAB



•

1 ·

ederarnegister / Vol. 33. No. 225 I Fridav.'Nosem'oer la. insa / Rules and Remulation:
·48813

'

T.itt OP AT 0 C

tr OPEUTED VALY

StouElti OPT

ADJ.fSTAM ,- .'

CHOKE

<9

e .

. 5M CHOKE MANIFOL EQU1PMENT- CONFIGURATION or CHDKT-5MAY VARY

•

•

$

I k &2518 Filed 11-17-85:2:O am)
URJ.am CCES 451%

e

e

oss

e



RW 34-34 AD

20" Conductor CSA 40-60'

<- AIR Drilled

3-3/8" 54.5# K-55 CSA 500'

Green River @3276'

Alr MIst - Aerated Water with sweeps

9-5/8" 47# HCP-110 Flush Jnt CSA 6300'

Wasatch @6526'

Mesaverde @9276'

Mud: Polymer System
Sego @11,601'

Castlegate @11,756'

Blackhawk @12,111'

Mancos Shale @12,570'
7" 26# & 29#special Drift for 6-1/8"
HCP-110 CSA 13,000'+l-(case off at least the Mancos Top)

Mancos "B" @12,985'

e Mud -OBM

Frontier @15,866'

Dakota @16,988'

Morrison @17,478'

4-1/2" 15.1 # HCP-110 & Q-125
CSA



Form3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED

(November 1994) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Šr.fo È
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0558
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

N/A
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement,Name and/or No.StiBMITM7RIÞi.lCATE O#aerIrrà&lregerasoerrevese side RED WASH UNIT

1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator RW 34-34AD
QUESTAR EXPLORATION& PRODUCTION, CO. 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36351
11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078 |435-781-4331 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T , R., M, or SurveyDescription) UNDESIGNATED
858' FSL 1944' FEL SWSE SECTION 34, T7S, R22E 11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity
Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon
Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly mate all patinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or reconelete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme vertical depths of al pertinent markers and zonca
Attach the Bond under which the work will be perfomed or provide the Bond No on file with 11LM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
Following conyletion of the involved operationa If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a F<rm 3160-4 shaR be filed once
Testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shaR be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been œmpleted, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY (QEP) REQUEST PERMISSION TO CHANGE THE OIL BASE
MUD PROGRAM FROM 500' TO 6,300' IN ORDER TO ENHANCE DRILLINGEFFICIENCY AND CAPTURE COST
SAVINGS.

ATTACHED IS A REVISED DRILLINGFLUIDS PROGRAM AND WELLBORE DIAGRAM.

FOR TECHNICALQUESTIONS, PLEASE CONTACTJIM DAVIDSON,CHIEF DRILLINGENGINEER FOR QEP
AT (303) 308-3090.

** RECEIVED
on,Gas andMinig OCTI 12007

FORRECORDONLY
14. I herebycertify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Prin ped) Title

sianatuels RegulatroryAffairs

TimesMCasoxPastWAI.onduttung
App'ved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify Office
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for anyperson knowinglyand willfullyto make to any departmentor agency ofthe United States any false, fictitious or

fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on reverse)
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Production Company
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Sec 34-T7S-R22E
Uintah County, Utah

Drilling Fluids Program

410 1f Street, Suite 460 Denver, CO 80202
(303) 623-2205 (720) 904-7970



† Newgark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17* Street, Suite 460 - Denver, Colorado 80202 - (303) 623-2205 - FAX (720) 904-7970

September 28, 2007

Mr. Jim Davidson
Chief Drilling Engineer
QuestarExploration & Production
1331 17th Street, Suite 800
Denver, Colorado 80202

RE: RW 34-34 AD
Sec 34-T7S-R22E
Uintah Co, Utah

Mr. Davidson:

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP is pleased to present the enclosed revised recommended drilling fluids program for the
RW 34-34 AD well to be drilled in Uintah County, Utah. This revised program is for drilling with Air/Water in the 1st inter-
mediate T.D. at 6300 ft, then to +/- 8000 ft depending on hole conditions.

The Surface Interval will be drilled with air to a depth of 500 ft.

For the Intermediate Interval, an optional Air/Mist drilling program is recommended. Offset wells in the area have drilled
with air to a depth of 1500-1700 ft +/- or until water intrusions were noted. After changing to Air/Water, due to hole stability
problems on offset wells, it is recommended to add KCL to the water for 2-3% KCL and maintain a Potassium Silicate con-
centration in the water for 0.25-0.50 % Silicate. (Approximately 3 sks per 100 ft drilled).

Brine kill pills may be needed for trips, logs, and casing operations, depending on pressure encountered while drilling.
Trona water flows in this area may require a mud weight of 9.5 ppg to control.
Mud weight at interval T.D. at 6,300' is expected to be in the 8.8-9.0 ppg range.

In the Liner interval, drill out with the Air/Water from the previous interval, continuing additions of KCL, and maintaining
3% through the Wasatch. At 7,500' - 8,000' depending upon hole conditions, begin a mud-up for a KCL/Polymer mud sys-
tem for properties as outlined in the following program. After drilling into the Mesa Verde, allow the KCL to deplete through
dilution allowing the system to convert to a NewPHPA/Polymer system.
Mud weight in this interval is expected to be in the 11.2-11.4 ppg range at the 13,000 ft liner interval T.D.

In the Production interval, displace to a 12.0-12.5 ppg OptiDrill OBM system. Maintain fluid density as low as possible to
increase penetration rates and reduce the possibility of lost circulation. Use high weight pills for well control during; trips,
logs, and casing operations. Mud weight at T.D. is expected to be at +/-15.5 ppg.

The projected drilling time for this project is 65-70 days with an estimated material and engineering cost of $500,000.00as-
suming no unusual delays or problems are encountered. The estimate is based on minimal losses and a 15.0 ppg mud weight
at TD. Costs will increase dramatically if severe losses are encountered.

All sack material and bulk barite will be furnished from our Grand Junction, Colorado facility, with OBM supplied from
Newpark's Boulder, WY facility.
If you have any questions following your review of this proposal, please call.

Regards,

Estes Ward
Operations Manager
Newpark Drilling Fluids,



Project Summary Explot oDciucGon

Se: 34-T7S-R22E
Uini sh, County Utah

Depth Formadone Interval Comments Mud Mud Properties(*0 Weight
(ppg)

lioie size: 17 1/2"/ Casing,: 13 3/8" NA NA
Uinta

AIR DRILLED
500' Surface T.D.

Air/KCL Water Air Vis (seriqr): Water
IIole size: 11 0"/< asing 9 5/8" Flush Joint

PV (cp): NA
Ddli out with Alr, maintaining 2100 +/- cim. When water le

3,276' Green River encountered reduce -Ir ta +/- 1400 efm and toadthe hele

Mahogeny with KCL brine at 2-3% KCL For increased hole stability gg i P (#s/100ftg NA
mix Patasolum Silicate for 0 2-0 5% (approximately 3
skel100 ft) FL (ml/30 min): NO

Pump pre-hydrated NewGei or Flowran tweept for in-
creased hole cleaning and for any tight hole andfor torque. IÁß •Ø I¾

For trips, apot heavy brine If needed for trona flow, and at pgg. ggIntermediate T.D. check hole conditions and spot high vis·
cosity mud if needed.

6,300' Intermediate Ci (mg/l): I I-15K
Mud weight at TD is expected to be In the 5.8-9.0 ppy rangeT.D. 8.8

KCI, %: 2.5-3.0

6,526' Wasaich Air/KCL Water 8.8 Vis (sec/qi): 40-45
9,276' Mesa Verde Hole size: 8 5 "i I,iner: 7 "

Drill outwith the fluid from the prevlous Interval, malntaln- PV (cp) : 12-20
Ing 2-3% KCL without SRicate additlona.

10,500 NewPHPA/Polymer (7500'-8000') 10.0
i P (#s/l00fia): 10-1211,601 Sego Mud up as hole conditlana dictate to a NewPHPA/Polymer

Buckto aystem Maintain proporties as outlined Increasing thengue
PHPA concentration to 1 ppb Ei, (ml/30 min): 6-8
Lost circuintion may be a problem In this Interval if lost

l 1,756' Casilegale circulauen in ancountered, pump LCM pills as needed. If I,GS %: 3-5
LCM pills will not control losses, by-pass the shakers and12,1 11' Blackhawk Increase the LCM concentration In the system as needed.
If severs 10st circulation is encountered, consider a pil: 10.0-10 5

12,570' Mancos Shale g, y be encountered in the Mena Verde Ï Î.2
MonRar torque, pump pressure, connection fill, and trip CI (mg/I): 1I-ißK

l 3,000'+/- Liner T.D. conditions for Indications of hole instabilNy and consider
adding Asphan If hole canditions dictate- KCI %: 0

OptiDrill OBM PV (cp) 15-25
Hofe size: 7 0"/ Casing: 4-1/2"

12,985' Mancos B Drillout with the OptlDrill system, treating cement con- 11.2 YP (Ibs/10erra): 8-10
taminationas needed with OptlWet to prevent shaker
blinding HPHT (mis/30 ruin): <20

Maintain hole cleaning during high ROP's with high vis- O/W : 80:20 - 85:15cosity sweeps Use a 1:1 ratio of OptiVla RM and Op-
15,866 Frontier equiv g¡yi,

Dakota Sill ES: 500+
16,988 Dakota CO2 in the gas stream while drilling under balanced will

require additional Lime, emulsifiers and wetting agent I,ime: 2-4 ppb
17,725 Total Depth Maintain mud weight as needed for well control. 15.5

Spot high weight ECD pills for trips, logs, and caelng LGS %: < 6
operations.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street. Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
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Project Summag Explorat's
n roDduction

Sec 34-T7S-R22E
Uintah, County Utah

DRILLINGFLUID PROPERTIES
Surface Hole: Air Drilled

Hole TVD Mud Plastic Yield API Total
Size (ft) Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss Solids(In) (ppg) (cp) (ib/100fF) (mlI30min) (%)

17 1/2 " 0-500' NA NA NA NA NA

Intermediate Hole: Air/KCL Water
Hole MD Mud Plastic Yield API KCL LGS
SIze (R) Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss I I ©
(in} (ppg; (cp) (Ib/100ft") (mlI30min)
11 500-6,300 8 5-8 6 NA NA NA 2-3 < 1%

Liner Interval: NewPHPA
Hole MD Mud Plastic Yield API KCL LGS
Sinze (ft) weight Viscosity Polnt Fluid LOSS (%) Solids

(cp) (Ib/100fta) (mil30min)
8 1/2 6,300'-8,000 8 5-8 8 NA NA NC 3.0 < 1%

8 1/2 " 8,000'-13.000 11 2-11 4 12-18 12-15 6-8 0 3-6

Production Interval: OptiDri/I OBM
Hale MO Mud Plastic Yield OIW HPHT CaCL Electrical LGSsize (n) weight Viscosity Polnt Ratio Fluid Loss (mg/I) Stability Solids
(in) (ppg) (cp) (lbl100ff) (%) (mlI30min) ogX (mv) (%)

7 0 " 13.000'-17.725 15 0-15 5 20-30 8-10 85/15 12-15 250-350 500 + 3-6

• Drillingfluid properties are guidelines only
• Mud weights for guidelines only, allow hole conditions to dictate actual mud weights
• Hole conditions should be closely monitoredand product mix adjusted accordingly,

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Questar
Intermediate Interval Ex¢oradon & Producuon

11" Hole (500'- 6,300') Sec
T73S4-AR

2E
UIntah, County Utah

Intermediate Interval Drilling Fluid Properties
Depth Mud Viscosity Plastic Yleid pH API Hardness Low KCL

Interval Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss Gravity

(TVD) (ppg) (sec/qt) (cp) (Ibl100ff) (mlI30min) Mg/1) Solids %

500'-1,800' +/- AIR NA NA NA NA NA NA NA 2.0-3.0

1,800'+/--6,300' 8.6-8.8 27-28 NA NA 10.5-10.8 NA <100 < 1.0 2.0-3.0

• Drill out with Air/Mist maintaining 3% KCL and 1% Potassium Silicate in the mist water.

• When water is encountered, load the hole with 3% KCL water and begin aerated water drilling.

• While drillingwith aerated begin additions FlexFirm ka (Potassium Silicate) for 0.2-0.5% (mix at 3 sks per 100 ft)

• Pump pre-hydrated NewGel sweeps for increased hole cleaning, and LCM sweeps for seepage (Paper LCM while drilling

with water)
• If water flows are encountered, spot heavy brine pills for trips, logs and casing operations.

• Offset information indicates the 1st major loss zone to be at +/- 3600 ft.

Challenges: Strategies:

GravellUnconsolidated formation
Ifencountered,pumpsweeps of pre-hydrated NewGel with a viscos-
ity of 150 -300 sec/qt.

Ifwater flows become excessive, mud up and increase mudweight

Water Flows (Trona) as needed for control. Treat carbonate contaminationwith Limel
Calclum Chloride as needed.

While drillingwith water, pump LCMsweeps consistingof paper.

Lost Circulation Ifdrillingwith mud, pump mixed LCMpills in the20-30% LCM
range.

Pump sweeps on a regular basis and for any indications of insuffi-

Hole Cleaning cient hole cleaning. Circulate and pump sweeps before connections
and for any anticipated down time.

Increase ROP with PDC Bits
Pump 20-40 bbl. Sweeps with NewEase 203, New100N, DynaDet,
and SAPP. (FlexDrillSweeps)

Hole Instability/Sloughing Shale Maintain KCL at 3% and Potassium Silicate at 0.2-0.5%

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Intermediate Interval Explorau n ducuon
11" Hole (500'- 6,300') gy gg.sy y,

Sec 34-T7S-R22E
Uintah, County Utah

Offset Data:
• Wells in this area have encountered major losses at +/- 3600 ft.
• Gravellunconsolidated formation has been encountered at 1380 ft.

Fluid Recommendations:
• Drillout cement, float collar and new formation. Test the integrity of the casing seat and squeeze if necessary.
• Drillout with Air/KCL Mist pumping +/- 2400 cfmair.
• When water is encountered, close in pits and begin Aerated water drilling. Bring KCL content to 3% and main-

tain0.2-0.5% Potassium Silicate. (Mix3 sks per 100 ft drilled.)
• Ifa Trona Water flow is encountered additionsof Lime and/or Calcium Chloride should be used to adjust alka-

linities as needed.
• The use of a premix tank is highly recommended. Pre-Hydrate NewGel for use as sweeps and for viscosity

when a mud up is needed. Fill premix tank with fresh water. Treat out hardness with SodaAsh as needed.
Add 0.25-0.5 ppb Caustic Soda for a 10.0-10.5 pH. Begin additions of 20-25 ppb NewGel allowsufficient cir-

culating time for maximum hydration. Add 1.0-2.0 ppb CFL II. Then mix additional NewGel (30-40 ppb total)or
a 120+ funnel viscosity. The pre-hydrated bentonite can be pumped from the premix to the pill tank and
pumped downhole for sweeps or can be added slowly to the 3% KCL water for viscosity and rheology control.

• If penetration rates slow sweeps with New 100N, NewEase 203, SAPP, and DynaDet should be considered.
(1% New 100N, 1% NewEase 203, 0.5-0.75 ppb SAPP, 0.2 % DynaDet). "Flex Sweeps"

• For trips, an increase in mud weight may be necessary to killwater flows. 9.8-10.0 ppg brine should be consid-

ered for thisoperation.
• Seepage and/or lost circulation may become a problem. For seepage while drillingwith water, pump 20-30 bbl

pills containing Paper LCM.
• If losses become severe, consider a mud up and LCM sweeps of Cedar Fiber and FIberSeal should be

pumped and incorporated into the system as needed. If losses continue, increase coarse LCM in active system
to 15-20%. If losses continue the use of a DynaPlug Squeeze is strongly recommended.

• At TD increase funnel viscosity for logs and casing operations as hole conditionsdictate. Suggest funnel vis-

cositybe increased to45-50 seclqt, before logging operations be attempted.

• At 6,300' ( intermediate T.D.) short trip,check hole conditions. If hole conditions dictate, add pre-hydrated New-

Gel from the premix tankto the active system to increase funnel viscosity to 45-50 sec/qt and spot in the open
hole for logs and casing operations

DRILL STRING PACK-OFF: Rapid penetration rate during fast drillingoftendeteriorates to pack<>ff,a situationwhich can
lead to lost circulation and/or stuck pipe. Pack-off is typicallyself-induced by exceeding the maximum rate of penetration
for a given annularflow rate. The solution to this is to control the penetration rate to a level that the pumps can adequately
clean the hole while maintaining rheological properties in line with existing hydraulic parameters.

SOLIDS CONTROL: It is of the utmost importance that the shale shakers and flow line cleaners be equipped with the fin-

est screens possible, and yet handle the flow rate. The desander and desilter units should be evaluated periodically and
servicedto maximize performance.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
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Liner Interval *"***'
Exploradon & Producuon

8 1/2" Hole (6,300'- 13,000') RW34-34AD
Sec 34-T7S-R22E

Uintah, County Utah

Liner Interval Drilling Fluid Properties
Depth Mud Viscosity Plastic Yleid pH API Hardness Low

Interval Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss Gravity
(TVD) (ppg) (sec/qt) (cp) (Ibl100ft=) (mlI30min) Mg/1) Solids

6,300'-8,000' 8.8-9.0 27-28 NA NA 10.0-10.5 NA 100+ < 1%

8,000'-13,000' 11.2-11.4 45-50 10-18 12-14 10.0-10.5 6-8 100+ 4-6

• Drill out with aerated water continuing additions of KCL until mud-up at 7500'-8000'. After mud-up , allow the system to
revert to a fresh water polymer system.

• As mud weight is increased, seepage losses can become severe. Treat with LCM pills as needed. If pill treatmentswill not

contain the losses at reasonable levels, by-pass the shakers, retaining the pills and allowing the LCM concentration to in-

crease as needed.
• Hole instabilitycan occur in the Mesa Verde in this area. If encountered, consider adding Asphalt, building to a 4-6 ppb

concentration.
• High pressure may be encountered in the Castlegate/Blackhawk. Monitor closely for increased pressure while drilling and

use caution on trips to minimize possible swabbing.
• Mud weight at Liner Interval T.D. is expected to be in the 11.2-11.4 ppg range.

Challenges: Strategies:

Hole Instability/Sloughing Shale Consider 4-6 ppb Asphalt

Monitor well conditionsand increase density as needed
Increase in Formation pressure with NewBar as needed.

As mud weight is increased (10.0ppg +) seepage and
losses may become a problem. For seepage pump 50
bbl sweeps with 5-10 ppb DynaFiber and 10-20 ppb
NewCarb as needed. For partial or total losses pump
sweeps with 10-15 ppb FiberSeal and Cedar Fiber.

Seepage/Lost Circulation Severity of losses willdetermine size and quantity of
LCMadded. If losses are not controlledwithsweeps
consider 10-15% LCM in active system. For severe
losses the use of a DynaPlug squeeze should be con-
sidered.

Maintain mud weight as low as possible. Control Low
Differential Sticking Gravity Solids below 6%, and control fluid loss at 8-10

mis/30 min.

Pump 20-40 bbl. Sweeps with NewEase 203, New100N,
increase ROP with PDC Bits DynaDet, and SAPP. (FlexDrillSweeps)

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
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Liner Interval *""'"'
Exploration & Production

8 1/2" Hole (6,300'-13,000') RW34-14AD
Sec 34-T7S-R22E

Uintah, County Utah

Offset Data:
Wells in thisarea have experienced losses as mudweights are increased to control formation pressure. LCMsweeps are
strongly recommended for thisreason. Mud weights should be keep as low as practical but increases to 11.2 ppg may be

required by Liner TD at 13,000'.
• Loss zones on offset wells were at 9200 ft and 9600 ft.

Fluid Recommendations:

• Drillout cement, float collar and new formation with the system from the previous interval. Test the integrity of

the casing seat and squeeze if necessary.
• Continue drilling with the aerated water from the previous interval until mud up at +/- 7500 ft or as hole condi-

tions dictate. After mud-up allow the KCL to naturally dissipate by dilution with fresh water. Begin additions of
0.5-1.0 ppb NewPHPA and maintain throughoutthe interval.

• Maintain viscosity with PreHydrated NewGel until chlorides have dropped below 5000-7000 mg/l. After chlo-

rides have dropped NewGel will not need to be pre-hydrated and can be added directly to the system.

• Begin additions of NewPHPA. Concentration of NewPHPA should be maintained at 0.5-1.0 ppb throughoutthe
interval. As mud weight increases additions of PHPA should be switched from NewPHPA DLMW to the shorter
chain NewPHPA DSL.

• If hole conditions dictate, consider 4-6 ppb Asphalt.
• If penetration rates slow sweeps with New 100N, NewEase 203, SAPP, and DynaDet should be considered.

(1% New 100N, 1% NewEase 203, 0.5-0.75 ppb SAPP, 0.2% DynaDet). "Flex Sweeps"

• Increase mud weight as needed to control formation pressures as needed. Mud weights should be maintained

as low as practical to reduce chance of losses and differential sticking. Increase mudweightas needed with
NewBar.

• As density increases additions of NewEdge and/or DrillThin should be added for rheology control.

• As bottom hole temperaturesincrease and additionalfluid loss controlis desired supplement the NewPAC with

DynaPlex for fluid loss control Lower API filtrate to 6-8 cc's withadditions of NewPAC and DynaPlex.

• As mud weight is increased seepage and/or lost circulation may become a problem. For seepage pump 20-30

bbl pills containing a combination of NewCarb and DynaFiber mixed at a 2:1 ratio. If partial or total returns are
encountered, LCM sweeps with a varied size distribution including Cedar Fiber and Fiber Seal, PhenoSeal
and other assorted sizes should be considered and incorporated into the system as needed. 20-25% LCM in

the active system may be required. The type, size and quantity of LCM used will depend on the severity of

losses. If losses are severe a DynaPlug squeeze should be considered.
• At TD increase funnel viscosity for logs and casing operations as hole conditions dictate. Suggest funnel vis-

cosity be increased to 50-55 sec/qt, before logging or casing operations be attempted.

• While circulatingcasing it is recommended to reduce Yield Points for cementing operations.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
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Prod uction Interval .*""""'

Exploration & Production
6 1/8" Hole (13,000'-17,725') RW34-34AD

Sec 34-T78-R22E
Uintah, County Utah

Production Interval Drilling Fluid Properties
Depth Mud Plastic Yleid O/W HTHP Excess Electrical Low CaCl

Interval Weight Viscosity Point Ratio Fluid Loss Lime Stability Gravity Mg/1
(TVD) (ppg) (cp) (Ibl100ft=) % (mlI30min) (PPB) (MV) Solids Water

13,000'-17,725' 15.0-15.5 25-35 8-10 85:15 12-15 2-4 500+ < 6 300K

Drilling Fluid Recommendations: (13,000'-17,725')
• Displace to a OptiDrill OBM after finishingthe liner job at 13,300'.
• After displacement, maintain the OptiDrill system within the parameters outlined above.
• Offsets in the area have encountered high rates of seepage in this interval. If indications of seepage are observed,

sweeps of NewCarb C, Dynafiber C & M, NewSeal, and CyberSeal are recommended. Mixing ratios are recom-

mended to be at 5:1 NewCarb M to DynaFiber , NewSeal, and CyberSeal. If losses continue to be a problem, con-

sider trying different sizes and combinations until ssepage is slowed.
• Maintain rheology low to reduce ECD values and reduce surge and swab during connections and trips.

• Drill as underbalanced as possible to help prevent losses and increase penetration rates.
• For pressure control, spot high weight pills with an equivalent mud weight to drilling ECD's. On trips in, stage these

pills out and divert to storage for further use. High weight pills in excess of the drilling ECD should be avoided due to
possible lost circulation.

Challenges Strategies

Displacement • Have 1200-1300 bbls of OBM volume on location along with a pump capable of keeping up

with displacementrates.
• Pump a 10-20 bbl viscosified OBM spacer ahead of the OpyiDrill (enough for 500 ft + sepa-

ration)
• A steady pump rate for either turbulent or plug flow should be used. Reciprocate and rotate

to assist in minimizing channeling.
• Do not shut down once displacementcommences.
• Should any contamination occur, isolate the contaminated fluid for reconditioning.

Seepagellost Circulation. Pump LCM sweeps when seepage and/or losses are indicated. Sweeps should be a mixture of ,

NewCarb, DynaFiber, NewSeal, and CyberSeal. If lost returns are encountered, consider a Di-

aseal M or cross linked polymer squeeze.

Maintaining Oil wet solids For every 1.0 ppg mud weight increase, mix 0.02 gal/bbl OptiWet

Pressure control • Spot weighted pills calculated to give a bottom hole pressure equal to drilling ECD.
• Do not exceed drilling bottom hole pressure with the ECD pill. Lost circulation has been a

problem on offset wells.
• Stage weighted pills out of the hole and recover for future use.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
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Production Interval ExporaN
nue

ducuon
6 1/8" Hole (13,000'-17,725') RW14-14AD

Sec 34-77S-R22E
Uintah, County Utah

Maintenance Procedure:

HPHT - Maintain HPHT values within programmed parameters. Additions of OptiMul and OptiPlus, at recommended
concentrations should maintain the HTHP at recommended levels. If hole conditions indicate a need for lower HPHT
values, Opti G at 2-4 ppb is recommended.

Electrical Stability- Electrical stability should be used as a guide not as an absolute in determining maintenance require-
ments. Actual values are not critical but should be observed for trends or changes. Decreases in electrical stability
should be noted along with other mud properties to determine treatments. To increase electrical stability add emulsifi-
ers and wetting agents OptiMul and OptiPlus or decrease water content.

Oil/Water Ratio - Maintain the oillwater ratio in the 90:10-80:20 range depending on mud weight and condition.. Higher
water content will decrease the amount of OptiVis needed for rheology.

Mud weight - Maintain minimum fluid densities with solids equipment. Monitor hole conditions and all drilling parame-
ters closely for indications of increases in formation pressures and adjust fluid densities accordingly. Drilling with a
minimum amount of overbalance will reduce the possibility of losing returns and/or of differentially sticking the drill
string. Mud weight on offset wells was in the 15.0-15.5 ppg range at T.D.

Rheology - Maintain solids as low as possible. Increase rheology as needed for hole cleaning with a combination of
OptiVis (Bentone 910) and Opti Vis RM or Opti Vis PS and water content.

Lime - Maintain the excess Lime at 2-3 ppb excess.

Hole cleaning - Calculate rheology requirements based on ROP, pump rates and hole conditions. Adjust as needed .

Mud losses downhole-Monitor ECD's with Hy-Calc, maintaining the lowest values possible. If losses are encountered;
sweeps containing NewCarb, DynaFiber, Opti-G, and NewSeal should be circulated to aid in the prevention of
losses. If seepage losses continue and/or become severe, consider spotting a pill with Magma Fiber (Fine & Regu-
Iar) and the above formulation. Keep the hole full at all times, and avoid excessive swabbing and/or surge actions
when tripping.

Solids Control - Maintain low gravity solids at 4-6 % by volume. The high performance shakers should be equipped with
the finest mesh screens that will handle the circulating volume and not cut barite out.

Water Contamination- Keep all water sources off the mud pits. If contamination occurs, treat with emulsifiers and Cal-
cium Chloride as needed.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
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Production Interval "***'
Exploradon &Production

6 1I8" Hole (13,000'-17,725') RWag.sgan
Sec 34-T7S-R22E

Uintah, County Utah

Recommended materials for relaxed filtrate OptiDrill system :

( 85:15 OiUWater Ratio)

Product Function Concentration

NewBar Weighting material As needed

OpfîVis |Organophilic Clay / Viscosifier 24 ppb

OptiMul Primary Emulsifier 2 0 ppb

OptiPius Secondary Emulsifier 4.0 gal/bbi

OptiVis RM Low End Rheology Modifier 0.1-0.2 ppb

Calclum Chloride Water Internal Phase 10 0%-20 0 % by volume

Calcium Chloride Salinity/Activity 300,000 - 350,000 mg/I

OpUG Fluid Loss control Additive 1.04 0 ppb

Lime IAlkalinity Additive 5 ppb
I

NewCarb M Loss CirculalionMaterial I10.0 ppb
I

NewCarb F Loss Circulation Material As required

DynaFiber Loss Circulation Material As required

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 480
Denver, CO. 80202
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RW 34-34 AD

20" Conductor CSA 40-60'

AIR Drilled

3-3/8" 54.5# K-55 CSA 500'

Green River @3276'

Air MIst - Aerated Water with sweeps

7" IIner top 500' above 9-5/8" casing shoe

9-5/8" 47# HCP-110 Flush Jnt CSA 6300'

Wasatch @6526'

Mesaverde @9276' $

Mud: Polymer System
Sego @11,601'

Castlegate @11,756'

Blackhawk @12,111'

Mancos Shale @12,570'
7" 26# & 29# special Drift for 6-1/8"
HCP-110 CSA 13,000' +I- (case off at least the Mancos Top)

Mancos "B" @12,985'

Mud -OBM

Frontier @15,866'

Dakota @16,988'

Morrison @17,478'

4-1/2" 15.1 # HCP-110 & Q-125
CSA



Well: API Number: Commenced:
WV 5W-36-7-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304734099 05/29/2003
WV 4D-12-8-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304734268 09/26/2003
WV 9W-11-8-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304734274 09/26/2003
Brennan 1 wcr 4304715417 07/19/200%
WV 8W-1-8-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304734009 06/16/2003
OU SG 4W-11-8-22 drlg rpts/wcr 4304735071 06/11/2005
OU SG 5W-11-8-22 drlg rpts/wcr 4304735072 06/11/2005
OU SG 14W-11-8-22 drlg rpts/wcr 4304735114 06/16/2005
OU SG 13W-11-8-22 drlg rpts/wcr 4304735377 06/16/2005
GH 16W-19-8-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304735325 06/27/2005
OU GB 8MU 10-8-22 drlg rpts/wcr 4304735422 03/22/2006
WV 3DML-13-8-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304737923 09/27/2006
GB 12SG-29-8-22 drlg rpts/wer 4304738766 04/25/2007
GB 4SG-36-8-21 drlg rpts/wcr 4304738764 05/03/2007
BZ 10D-16-8-24 drlg rpts/wcr 4304737671 05/09/2007
RW 34-34AD drlg rpts/wcr 4304736351 06/07/2007
RWS 14D-6-9-24 drlg rtps/wer 4304737414



NOTICE

Utah Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-21 states that,

> A well is considered completed when the well has been adequately worked to be capable
of producing oilor gas or when well testingas required by the division is concluded.

> Within 30 days after the completion or plugging of a well, the following shall be filed:
• Form 8, Well Completion or Recompletion Report and Log
• A copy of electric and radioactivitylogs, if run
• A copy of drillstem test reports,
• A copy of formation water analyses, porosity, permeability or fluidsaturation

determinations
• A copy of core analyses, and lithologiclogs or sample descriptions if compiled
• A copy of directional, deviation, and/or measurement-while-drilling survey for

each horizontal well

Failure to submit reports in a timelymanner willresult in the issuance of a Notice of Violation
by the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining,and may result in the Division pursuing enforcement
action as outlined in Rule R649-10, Administrative Procedures, and Section 40-6-11 of the
Utah Code.

As of themailing of this notice, the division has not received the required reports for

Operator: Questar Exploration & Production Co Today's Date: 11/27/2007

Well: API Number: Drilling Commenced:

See Attachment

To avoid compliance action, required reports should be mailed within 7 business days to:
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

If you have questions or concerns regarding this matter, please call (801) 538-5284.

cc: Well File
Compliance



Questar E & P Page 1 of 7

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date Fmm - To Hours Code CSu Description of Operations

10/17/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 03 A DRILL TO 540, RUN 13 3/8 CASING 502'
11:30 - 14:30 3.00 05 H CEMENT SURVFACE CASING CREW

11/2/2007 07:00 -19:00 12.00 01 A RECEIVED 28 LOADS- BOTTOM SUB, 2 LOADSOF MATTING BOARDS,2 SUB
SPEADERS, BOTH DOG HOUSES, CHOKE MANIFOLD, VOLUME TANK, 2 SUIT
CASE SKlDS, BOTH PUMPS, BOTH WATER TANKS, 1 MOTOR, FUEL TANK,
HOPPER HOUSE, CAT WALK, MIDDLE PIECES OF DERRICK, KOOMY HOUSE,
2 JUCK TUBS, MISC. PIECES TRUCK, PUMP PARTS HOUSE, BOILER,
ANNULAR AND OTHER PIECES. SET MATTING BOARDS, DRILLER SIDE SUB,
AND PART OF OFF DRILLER SIDE SUB, SET IN CHOKE HOUSE AND SHAKER
PIT (ONLY HAVE 6 HANDS PUTTING RIG TOGETHER)

19:00 -06:00 11.00 WAIT ON DAY LIGHT TO START TO RIG UP
11/3/2007 07:00 -19:00 12.00 RECEIVED 13 LOADS TODAYTOP SUB, 3 LOADS OF DERRICK, DRILLING

LINE, WIND WALLS, FLOOR PLATES, BLOCKS, DERRICK STAND, SCR
HOUSE. TOP DRIVE SCR, BOPE (SINGLE, DOUBLE GATE, MUD CROSS), PIPE
RACKS, SUCTION TANK (BAR LINE INSN'T GOING TO WORK TO MUCH
RESRICTION), ALSO GOING TO RE DO FLOW LINE TO DRILL WITH AIR, SO IT
WON'T WASH OUT 90'S), --SET TOP SUB AND SPREADERS SET IN, SET IN
SHKERS, SUCTION TANK(PUT UP ALL HAND RAILS UP), HAVE PUSHER, 2
DRILLERS, 4 HANDS)

19:00 -06:00 11.00 WAIT ON DAT LIGHT TO SET IN RIG
11/4/2007 07:00 -19:00 12.00 01 RECEIVED TOP DRIVE AND PIECES, MOTOR, -SET IN LOW PRESSURE

HOUSE, PARTS HOUSE, MUD PUMPS, WINTERIZATION HOUSES, SCR
HOUSE, WATER TANKS, (CAN'T SENT ANY MORE OF PACKAGE #1 MOTOR
HASN'T SHOWED UP YET TOTAL OF MISSING LOADS 4- DRAW TOOL,#1
MOTOR, WIRE TRAY AND SOME MISC. LOAD. WORKING ON FLOW LINE TO
DRILL WITH AIR

19:00 -06:00 11.00 14 E WAIT ON DAY LIGHT
11/5/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A SET IN FLOW LINE, GRASS HOPPER, MOTOR SHEDS, ASSEMBLE DERRICK

(HAVN'T PUT A-LEGS ON YET), SET IN OFF DRILLER DOG HOUSE, LIGHT
POLES AND SHAKE SLIDES ON MUD TANKS, PULL CORDS TO GRASS
HOPPER, HAVE TWO FULL CREWS TODAY

18:00 -06:00 12.00 11 F WAIT ON DAY LIGHTS TO START PUTTING EQUIPMENT TOGETHER
11/6/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 01 A SET IN FUEL TANK, BOILER, GAS BUSTER, DRAWWORKS, PUT A-LEGS ON

DERRICK, ISTALL BRIDEL LINE, KELLY HOSE, FABING ON HOPPER LINES.
TOP DR1VESADDLE, GAS BUSTER RETURN, STAND FOR FLOW LINE,

18:00 -06:00 12.00 11 F WAIT ON DAY LIGHT TO RIG UP
11/7/2007 06:00 -15:00 9.00 01 TIE ON TO DERRICK WITH CRANES AND RAISE DERRICK TO FLOOR, FIRST 2

PINS TOOK 3 HOURS TO PIN (TIGHT HOLE FOR PIN), TRIED TO UN PIN
A-LEGS HAD TO LAY DOWN A LEGS TO GET PINS OUT OF DERRICK, TOOK 1
1/2 HR.S TO PIN 4 PINS ON A- LEGS, 1 HR RAISE DERRICK BOARD AND PIN

15:00 - 18:00 3.00 01 SET IN SUIT CASE FOR KOOMY HOUSE, STAIRS AND LANDINGS, SET IN
SOLIDS CONTROL EQUlPMENT AND BAR HOPPERS, FABBING LINES FROM
FLOW LINE TO BUSTER AND MUD CLEANER

11/8/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 01 A SET IN FLOW EXTENTION, KOOMY HOUSE, HAVING PROBLEMS WITH
COMMUNICATION WITH SCR HOUSE TO CONTROL PANEL ON FLOOR,(THEY
TOOK THE PANEL THAT WAS ON THIS RIG DOWN IN OKC AND PUT IT ON A
RIG SOME WHERE ELSE, THIS CONTROL PANEL WAS IN THE CASPER YARD)
FABING GAS BUSTER LINES, FINISH RIGGING UP SOLIDS CONTROL, SET IN
REST OF STAIRS, RECEIVED TWO LOADS OF COLLARS, AND PIPE TUB OF
DRILL PIPE,SET REST OF FLOOR PLATES IN, STRUNG UP DERRICK WITH
STRING UP CREW

18:00 -06:00 12.00 WAIT ON DAY LIGHT TO RIG UP NEW RIG
11/9/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A FOUND PROBLEM IN SCR CONTROL PANEL, SPOOL DRILLINGLINE ONTO

Printed: 12/3/2007 10 38:10 AM
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

11/9/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 01 A DRUM AND CINCHED DOWN ON DEAD MAN, DO DERRICK INSPECTION,
HELD DERRICK OFF STAND, RAISED DERRICK (COULD ONLY PIN 1 PIN ON
EACH SIDE- THEY HAD THE SAME PROBLEM ON 327-THE RIG THAT CAME
OUT OF THE YARD BEFORE THIS ONE, ALSO THEY ONLY PINNED TWO PINS
IN OKC YARD) HOOK UP MUD LINE HOSE FROM SHED TO SUB, RAISE
CHOKE MANIFOLD UP ONE HOLE, SET IN FLARE BOX AND PUT HAND RAILS
UP AROUND RIG, FILL WATER TANK WITH WATER(REPAIR WATER LEAKS
(ALOT OF LEAKS), RECEIVED 3 LOADS OF PIPE (DON'T HAVE HARD
BANDING ON JTS OF PIPE)-UNITS HEAD WELDER SHOULD BE HERE
TODAY TO FIX DERRICK PIN HOLES

18:00 06:00 12.00 08 E WAIT ON DAY LIGHT TO CONTNUE RIGGING UP
11/10/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 08 COULDN'T GET DERRICK PINNED (HAD TO GET HYDRILIC JACKS AND PUSH

DERRICK OUT TO GET TO PIN). COULON'T CUT OUT AND WELD DERRICK
EARS WHILE STANDING(UNIT WELDER), GOING TO CUT OUT EARS ON NEXT
MOVE AND WELD WHEN DERRICK IS ON GROUND,

11:30 -15:30 4.00 01 A RUN MUD PUMPSWITH OMRON REP. ON LOCATION, WORK ON STEAM
SYSTEM, RIG UP AIR TUGGERS. UNBRIDLED DERRICK RECEIVED 2 LOADS
OF DRILL PIPE, FINISHED WITH FLOW LINE TO GAS BUSTER LINE. BUILDING
RETURN LINEFROM BUSTER AND TARGET T'S FOR CHOKE LINES,

15:30 - 18:00 2.50 08 LEVEL DERRICK HAD TO TAKE 1/2" SHIMSOUT OF OFF DRILLER SIDE AND
PUT IN 2 1/4" OF SHIMS ON DRILLER SIDE (DERRICK WAS 7" TO DRILLER
SIDE AND 4" TOWARD DRAWWORKS)

18:00 -06:00 12.00 11 F WAIT ON DAYLIGHTS
11/11/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 01 A INSTALL RAILINGFOR BOPE HANDLING SYSTEM AND CRAWLERS, RIG UP

TONGS, PLACE WIRE LINE MACHINE ON FLOOR, CUT BOARDS FOR
RACKING AREA, RAISE CHOKE MANIFOLD, FABBING FLARE LINES, GAS
BUSTER VENT LINE, WORK ON STEAM SYSTEM AROUND RIG

13:00 -20:00 7.00 08 TRY TO CENTER DERRICK OVER WELL, FROM MAINSUPPORT BRACE TO
TOP OF CRAZY WHEEL BRACE IS 2 1/2 1NCHES DIFFERNCE-ODS 53 3/4" DS
51 1/4", HAVE 2 1/4" SHIMS ON MAIN SUPPORTS DRILLER SIDE

20:00 -06:00 10.00 08 WAIT ON DAY LIGHTS (UNIT SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT, NEEDS WELDER
TO WELD PLATE FOR PORTA POWER TO PICK ADJUSTER LEVEL)

11/12/2007 06:00 -09:30 3.50 08 CENTER BLOCKS OVER WELL, WAS GETTING CLOSE, WIND BREEZE CAME
UP PUSHING BLOCKS, SO STARTED PICKING UP TOP DRIVE

09:30 -18:00 8.50 01 A WELD COMPENSATER PLATES TO BLOCKS, PICK UP SWIVEL, TOP DRIVE
RAlL,

18:00 -06:00 12.00 12 O WAIT ON DAY LIGHTS
11/13/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A FINISH RIG UP TOP DRIVE RAIL. STRING OUT CORDS AND PUT IN SADDLE.

HANG SADDLE, PICK TOP DRIVE TO FLOOR, INSTALL COMPENSATOR RAMS,
AND HOOK UP CONTROLL PANEL, SET IN STEAM HEATERS, SET IN AIR
PACKAGE (BASIC), CONTINUE FABBING CHOKE MANIFOLD LINES

18:00 -06:00 12.00 08 E WAIT ON DAY LIGHTS
11/14/2007 06:00 -09:30 3.50 01 A SCREW SWIVEL TO TOP DRIVE, (CHILLER OUT IN TOP DRIVESCR HOUSE),

INSTALL TORQUE BUSHING, STRING CORDS TO TOP DRIVE HOUSE,
09:30 -14:30 5.00 01 A RIG TOP DRIVE DRILLER CONTROLL PANEL, ASSEMBLE TOP DRIVE

HYDRILIC LINES, PUT 10" FLARE LINES TOGETHER, PLUMB OfESEL TO
BOILER, FIRE BOILER

14:30 - 18:00 3.50 01 A RIG UP TOP DRIVE ELECTRIC LINES. INSTAL TURN BUCKLES, CENTER RAIL,
INSTALL FORCED AIR HEATER TUBES, CUT BOARDS FOR RACKING BOARD

18:00 -06:00 12.00 01 A INSTALL STAND PIPE MANIFOLD, PUT TARP ON TOP DRIVE WIRES,
PRESSURE TEST STEM LINES (FIX LEAKS) TIGHTEN BOLTS ON STAND PIPE,

11/15/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 01 A PUT UNION ON SWIVEL (NEED TO BUILD GOOSE NECK TO HOLD HOSE

Printed: 12/3/2007 10:38:10



Questar E & P Page 3 of 7

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code "d Description of Operations

11/15/2007 06:00 -11:00 5.00 01 A AWAY FROM UNIT), LAY OUT 4" FLARE LINES, SWITCH AROUND HYDRILIC
LINE AND ANTI FREEZE (BOTH ARE CONTAMINATED),TOP DRIVE BLEW A
SEAL IN INTENSIFIER

11:00 -15:00 4.00 01 A SET IN 400 BBL TANK FOR NACL WATER AND UNLOAD 500 BBL ROLL TANKS
FOR INVERT, CUT CONDUCTOR AND HAMMER OFF CEMENT, RIG UP
HYDRALIC LINES TO BOPE LIFT

15:00 -16:30 1.50 08 RE-TEST INTENSlFIER (REBUILT SEALS LEAKED STILL)
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 14 MAKE FINAL CUT AND TWO HOLE WELL HEAD WITH CAMERON, LEVEL HEAD

AND WELD HEAD,FABBING FINISHED GAS BUSTER RETURN, ALMOST DONE
WITH 4" LINES,

18:00 -20:00 2 00 08 E STRETCH PIT LINER OUT FOR INVERT TANKS
20:00 - 22:30 2 50 14 STACK SINGLE GATE AND MUD CROSS AND DOUBLE GATE
22:30 -06:00 7 50 08 WAIT ON TOP DRIVE UNIT-INSTALL FLOOR MATS AND FRONT WIND WALLS,

HOOK UP STEAM HEATER ON RIG FLOOR, CLEAN OUT TRASH OUT OF MUD
TANKS,

11/16/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1 50 08 RIGUP REMOTE KOOMY LINE AND AIR LINE
07:30 -10:30 3 00 08 RIG UP AND TORQUE SWIVEL AND TOP DRIVE
10:30 -12:00 1 50 08 SET 500 BBL 1NVERT MUD TANKS
12:00 - 13:30 1 50 08 REPAIR EATON WATER COOLING SYSTEM
13:30 -15:00 1 50 08 DISASSMBLE PUMP SKID OFF OF TOP DRIVE UNIT
15:00 -16:00 3 00 08 HOOK UP FLARE LINES, MAKE UP HYORILIC LINES FOR BOPE, START TIGOA

FORCED AIR HEATER, AND GEL MUD TANK GATES
18:00 - 20:00 2 00 08 RIG UP STEAM LINES IN PUMP SHED ,INSTALL HYDRAULIC FITTINGS ON

BOPE FOR KOOMY
20:00 -23:00 3 00 08 CHANGE OUT TOP DRIVE CHILLER UNIT WITH BOOM TRUCK
23:00 -00:00 1 00 08 FINISH HOOKING UP STEAM LINES IN PUMP SHED, BUILD BURM AROUND

INVERT STORAGE TANKS
00:00 -03:00 300 08 CHANGE HOOKSON TONGHANGINGLINES, ANDADD WEIGHT TO

COUNTER WEIGHTS
03:00 -06:00 3 00 08 ROLL UP PIT LINEER, RIGUP DRILLRS STEAM HEATER, WORK ON COLLING

LEAK ON DRAW WORKS, HANG BAILSON TOP DRIVE
06:00 -

11/17/2007 06:00 -08:00 2 00 08 BREAK OUT UNION OUT OF SWIVELlWORK ON COOLANT LINES ON
DRAW-WORKS

08:00 - 14:00 6 00 08 HELP WELDERSON FLARE LINESAND BUILD BLOW DOWN LINE ON BOILER
14:00 - 18:00 4 00 14 PICK UP ANNULAR, BLEW HOSE ON SNUBBING IN TRUCK (BOP LIFT SYSTEM

WON'T PICK UP ANN.), SNUBBING TRUCK BLEW HYDRILIC LINE
18:00 -03:00 9 00 14 INSTALL SPACER SPOOL AND ROT.HEAD, HAD B.C QUICK TEST TORQUE

ALL CONECTIONS, PUT OIL IN KOOMY, AND CONNECT KOOMY LINES. FILL
MUD TANKS HALF FULL AND INSTALL WALK WAYS IN SUB (SCAFOLDING)

03:00 -06:00 300 01 A PUT BRACEIN FOR TOP DRIVE RAIL AND PICK UP TOOLS AROUND RIG
11/18/2007 06:00 -07:00 1 00 01 A PUT ELECTIRIC MOTOR ON AGITATOR, TEST ALL MUD LINES (FIX LEAKS),

AND CHECKED ALL AGITATORS
07:00 -15:00 8 00 14 PUT CHOKE LINE IN (NOT TIGHT), CHANGE AROUND BLIND AND PIPE RAMS,

FUNCTION TEST RAMS
15:00 -18:00 3 00 01 A HOOK UP KELLY HOSE ADJUST TRACK, PUT VALVE IN FLOW LINE FOR TRIP

TANK RETURN, UNLOAD MUD PRODUCTS,
18:00 - 21:00 3 00 01 A STRAIGHTEN UPTOPTRACK IN DERRRICK,
21:00 -03:00 6 00 01 A HOOK UP FILLUP IN LINE, STAND PIPE, GAUGE ELEVATORS, GROUND

BUILDINGS, BRING SUBS TO RIG FLOOR, BUILD LINE AND HANGNG CABLES
FOR MUD BOX, BUILD LINE AND HANG PIPE SPINNERS,

03:00 -06:00 3 00 01 A BUILD BLEED OFF LINE ON #2 MUD PUMP, --WELD FABBED 1
EXTENTION-SLIDE FOR SHAKERS. FINISHED CELLER GRATTING,
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Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
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11/19/2007 06:00 -07:00 1,00 01 A PUT SAFETY LINE ON TOP DRIVE SERVICE LOOP IN DERRICK
07:00 -09:00 2.00 01 A MOVE SCAFOLDING FOR WELDER. PULL FLOOR PLATE AND PREPARE TO

LOWER BOP HANDLING RAIL
09:00 -12:30 3.50 08 FIX COOLANT LINE ON TOP DRIVE
12:30 - 13:30 1.00 01 A ADJUST COUNTER BALANCE ON TOP DRIVE
13:30 -15:30 2.00 01 A LOWER BOP HANDLING RAIL AND LOAD OUT KELLYPIECES
15:30 -18:00 2.50 01 A RE SET ROTATING HEAD AND SPACER SPOOL (TURN WHERE IT WOULD

FACE STRAIGHT
18:00 - 21:00 3.00 01 A FINISH TIGHENING ROTATING HEAD AND ADJUST TOP DRIVE TRACK
21:00 - 21:30 0.50 01 A GET MEASURE MENT OF BOPE EQUIPMENT, AND RIG UP GERONIMO LINE
21:30 -00:00 2.50 01 A MAKE CABLESTO CENTER BOPE, RIG UP CABLES IN SUB, PULL BOPE TO

CENTER
00:00 -02:30 2.50 01 A RIG UP PULLEY IN DERRRICK FOR WIRE LINE MACHINE. AND PULL CORD
02:30 -04:30 2.00 01 A SET IN YELLOW DOGS AND RUN POWER CORDS
04:30 -05:30 1.00 01 A ADJUST COUNTRER WEIGHT ON DERRRICK CLIMBER
05:30 -06:00 0.50 01 A CHECK ALL SAFETY EQUIPMENT, AND FILL, UNLOAD WESTERN CHEMICAL

BARRELS
11/20/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A HOOK UP GERONIMO LINE, HELP WELDERSINSTALL ORBIT VALVE, TAKE

OUT SCM BOARD IN TOP DRIVE HOUSE AND TROUBLE SHOOT COM
BOARDSIN TOP DRIVE HOUSE, HOOK UP PASON AND INTER COM TO
DERRICK, RIG UP YELLOW DOG, AND ROLL#2 MUD PUMP CHECK OILING IN
PUMP CHECKED O.K.

18:00 - 21:00 3.00 01 A PRESSURE TEST MUD LINES TO 1000 PSI FIX LEAKS, TIGHTEN CAPS ON
PUNPS. UNIONS, ECT.

21:00 -23:00 2.00 01 A BUILD ROTATING MANIFOLD, HOOK UP OILER BOX AND HOOK UP FILL UP
LINES

23:00 -00:00 1.00 01 A REPLACE SHEIVE ON BOPE SNUB, AND RIG UP AND BLOW DOWN KELLY
HOSE

00:00 -02:30 2.50 01 A PUT 6" DRAIN IN BOTTOM OF GAS BUSTER, TURN FLAPPER IN VENT LINE,
AND INSTALL BOLTS IN FLANGES IN BUSTER

02:30 -04:00 1.50 01 A ADD GROUND RODS AND CABLES WHERE NEEDED AROUND RIG, BUILD
HOESE FOR TRIP TANK

04:00 -06:00 2.00 01 A RE ADJUST GERONIMO LINE, REBUILD AIR MANIFOLD, BLOW DOWN MUD
LINES THRU PUMPS, REPLACE LAYDOWN LINE, CLEAN AND PUT AWAY
TOOLS,WELD- FLOW LINE FINISHED, HAVE BAR LINE ON TANKS, AND
TROUGHS TO BUILD TO PIT, SAFETY ITEMS AROUND RIG

11/21/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A HOOK UP LINE FOR TRIP TANK, AND INSTALL COM, CHECK OIL LEVELS IN
PUMPS, AND DRAW-WORKS, INSTALLRETURN LINES IN FLARE BOX, MAKE
UP BAR MANIFOLD, RIG UP AIR FOR AIR JAMMERS, REPLACED ECM BOARD
IN TOP DRIVE HOUSE, WORK ON TOP DRIVE COUNTER BALANCE, INSTALL
FOOTING ON WELL HEAD (READY TO CEMENT CELLER)

18:00 - 21:30 3.50 01 A PUT DIFFERNT SIZE CABLE ON BOPE CENTERING, AND SNUB CENTER AND
PUT UP SUB TARP AND INSTALL PASON EQUIPMENT ON THE END OF DRUM
SHAFT

21:30 - 23:00 1.50 01 A BUILD DIRT BURM OVER GAS BUSTER LINES AND INSTALL TARGET T ON
THE END OF FLOW LINE AND INSTALL DIFFERNT TROUGHS FOR CENTER
FUGES AND PUT DRAIN ON GAS BUSTER

23:00 -01:30 2.50 01 A INSTALL MOUSE HOLE AND FIND BHA X-OVERS AND PICK TO RIGFLOOR
AND RE PLUMB T-BLOCK ON CHOKE MANIFOLD TO

01:30 -03:00 1.50 01 A REPAIR STEM LEAKSAROUND RIGAND PICK UP TRASH AND TOOLS
AROUND RIG,

03:00 -06:00 3.00 01 A RACK BHA AND STRAP AND HOUSE KEEPING AROUND RIG
11/22/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00 01 A (CALLED AND NOTIFIED BLM OF BOP TEST- RAY ARNOLD) FUNCTION TEST
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Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
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11/22/2007 06:00 -14:00 8.00 01 A BOPS REPAIR HYD. LEAKS FILL BOTTOM OF CELLAR WI CMT TO BASE RING.
CALB. PASON MUD VOLUME SYSTEM WITH MUD TANKS, ADJUST LINK TILT
ON TOP DRIVE, START RIGGING UP YELLOW DOGS TO PUMP WATER FROM
UP RIGHT TANKS OR WAIST PIT & FAB. & INSTALL SHAKER CUTTING SLIDES
CONT. TO FRAB. & INSTALL BARITE LINES ON SUCTION TANKS INSTALL
ROT. MOUSE HOLE

14:00 - 18:00 4.00 01 A RIG UP &P/UP TESTINGEQUIPMENT
18:00 -06:00 12.00 08 D P/T BOPSATT TO TEST UPPER RAMSOBSERVE LOWER RAMSLEAKING @

DOOR REPLACE DAMAGED BONNET RUBBERS ATT. TO TEST U.RAMS BLIND
RAMS LEAKING @DOORS RE-TIGHTEN BONNET BOLTS & RETEST SAME
LEAK ATT. PULL OUT TEST JOINT DRAWWORKS WOULD NOT WORK SHUT
OFF POWER & RE-BOOT SYSTEM STILL NOT OPERATING CALLED UNIT
TECHNICIAN & ELE. DISCUSS OVER PHONE THE PROBLEM THEY WAS
UNABLE TO FlX PROBLEM OVER THE PHONE AT THE MOMENT THE
TECHICAN AND ELE. IS IN ROUTE TO THE RIG SITE.

11/23/2007 06:00 - 18:30 12.50 08 WAIT ON UNITSELECTRICAN ARRIVED @1330 HRS TROUBLE SHOOT
FOUND LOOSE CONNECTION TO POWER SUPPLY GOING TO DRILLER
CONSOLE SWITCH PANEL (DC MODULE WAS NOT GETTING POWER)

18:30 -22:30 4.00 08 D PULL OUT TEST JOINT & CHANGE OUT BONNET SEAL RUBBERS ON BLIND
RAMS DOORS.

22:30 -03:00 4.50 15 TEST BOPS ANN. LOW 250 PSI HIGH TEST 3500 PSI, ALL RELATED BOPS &
EQUIPMENT TESTED W/ LOW 250 PSI & HIGH 5000 PSI (SHELL TESTED
BOPS & CHOKE MANIFOLD TO 10000 PSI )P/TEST SUFACE CASING 1500 PSI

03:00 -06:00 3.00 19 C PICK UP BHA & NEW DRILL PIPE
11/24/2007 06:00 -11:00 5.00 08 ATTEMPT TO TORQUE UP BHA CONNECTIONS M/UP TONG LINE ON CAT

HEAD WAS TO LONG RECUT &ATT. TO TORQUE UP FIRST CONNECTION
BLOW HYDRAULIC HOSE ON M/UP CAT HEAD CYLINDER REPLACE HYD.
HOSE

11:00 - 15:00 4.00 06 J M/UP BIT ON NEW SUBS & COLLARS (M/UP & BREAK OUT NEW
CONNECTION TWICE DUE TO NEW BHA )

15:00 -03:00 12.00 06 P/UP NEW DRILL PIPE TORQUE UP BREAK LOOSE & RE-TORQUE ALL
CONNECTION (TOTAL DRILL PIPE P/UP & IN DERRICK 2104')

03:00 -06:00 3.00 08 DRAWWORKS STOP WORKING (LOST POWER SUPPLY TO DC MODULE )
11/25/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00 08 REPAIR ORAWWORKS LOST POWER TO DC MODULE

14:00 -06:00 16.00 06 P/UP NEW 5' DRILL PIPE TORQUE UP &BREAK OUT & RE-TORGUE ALL
CONNECT.
AND RACK BACK IN DERRICK (TOTAL 53 STDS IN DERRICK )

11/26/2007 06:00 - 20:00 14.00 06 PICK UP NEW HWDP & TORQUE UP & BREAK OUT & M/UP RIH W/ 12 1/4 BHA
TAG TOPOF CMT. 469'

20:00 -21:00 1.00 25 DRILL OUT CMT Fl469' TO TOP OF LIC @476' BRAKESSYSTEM NOT
WORKING UNABLE TO MAINTAINCORRECT BIT WT

21:00 -06:00 9.00 08 ATT. TO WORK STRING AND ADJUST AIR RELAY VALVE TO CONTROL DRILL
STRING SPEED (CALL UNITS SUP. & MECH. )WAIT ON MECH.

11/27/2007 06:00 -06:00 24.00 08 ON UNITS TIME (DRAWWORKSNOT WORKING PROPERLY BRAKESNOT
HOLDING TROUBLE SHOOT FOR THE PAST 24 HOURS WITH RIG SUP. &
TOOLPUSHER REPLACE HYD HOSESTHAT WASLEAKINGGOING TO HYD.
BRAKE CONTROL & BOTH AIR RELAY VALVE & CONTROL VALVE ON
DRILLER CONSOLE ATT. TO WORK STRING STILL BRAKE NOT HOLDING
STRING WT PROPERLY (WAIT ON UNITS HEAD MECHANIC)

11/28/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 08 REPAIR DRAWWORKS - REMOVE QU1CK RELEASE @EATON BRAKE TO
STOP AIR FROM DUMPING QUICKLY PER EATONS RECOMONDATION WHICH
WAS CAUSING THE BRAKE TO OPERATE ERRATICLY REPLACED H-4 VALVE
REPLACED RELAY VALVE , EXTENDED BRAKE HANDLE 6"
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11/28/2007 13:00 -15:30 2.50 02 D DRILL OUT SHOE TRACK & 15' 12 1/4 HOLE
15:30 -16:00 0.50 08 E FIT EQUIVALENT TEST TO 10.5 PPG
16:00 -16:30 0.50 25 HOLD SAFETY MEETING W/ BASIC AIR CREW & RIG CREWS
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 05 A DRILL OUT RAT HOLE FI SHOE TO 540'
18:00 - 18:30 0.50 25 HOLD SAFETY MEETING Wl BASIC AIR CREW & RIG CREWS
18:30 -22:30 4.00 03 A DRILL Fl 540' TO 676' (136' @34' FPH )2000 +/- CFM, ATT. TO MAINTAIN20

WOB
22:30 -23:00 0.50 25 STOP DRILLING PICK UP & WORK ON BASIC (AIR )PUMP
23:00 -02:30 3.50 03 A DRILL F/ 676' TO 817' (141'@ 41' FPH )2000+/- CFM WOB 20
02:30 -03:00 0.50 25 PICK UP &WORK ON BASIC (AIR )PUMP
03:00 - 06:00 3.00 03 A DRILL F/ 817' TO 940' (123' @41' FPH )2000 +/- CFM WOB 20

11/29/2007 06:00 -13:30 7.50 03 A DRILL Fl940' TO 1284' (344' @45.8' FPH )WOB 15-20 CFM 1950 +/-

13:30 -16:00 2.50 05 CIR. HOLE CLEAN FLOW LINE & FLARE BOX FULL OF CUTTINGREMOVE
CUTTING

16:00 -06:00 14.00 03 A DRILL Fl 1284' TO 1820' (536' @38.2' FPH )WOB 10 CFM 2000 +/-

11/30/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 02 DRILL FI 1815' TO 1861' (46' @30,6 FPH )WOB 15 2000 +/- CFM
07:30 - 10:00 2.50 06 TRIP TO 1420'
10:00 - 12:00 2.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE REAMED LAST TWO STDS
12:00 - 18:00 6.00 02 AIR DRILL 12 1/4" HOLE FI 1661' TO 2085 (224' @37 3 )WOB 15 2000 +/- CFM
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 02 AIR DRILL 12 1/4" HOLE F/2085' TO 2149 (64'@ 64') WOB 25-34 2000 +/- CFM
19:00 -20:00 1.00 02 RIG SERVICE
20:00 -00:00 4.00 02 AIR DRILL 12 1/4" HOLE F/ 2149' TO 2384 (235° @59 )WOB 22-32 2000 +/-

CFM
00:00 -01:00 1.00 08 E STOP DRILLINGBOLT FELL OUT OF DERRICK ( INSPECTED DERRICK FOUND

BOLT WORK LOOSE ON TOP DRIVE RAIL) TOP CLAMP INSTALL BOLT
TORQUE SAME AND FOUND TO MORE LOOSE ON CLAMP

01:00 - 04:30 3.50 03 A AIR DRILL 2384' TO 2527' (143' @41' )WOB 20- 32 2000 +/- CFM
04:30 -05:30 1.00 02 MAKE CONNECTION ATT.TO CIR. HOLE PACKED OFF, BLEED PRESSURE

OFF ATT. TO ROTATE STRING TOP DRIVE STOP WORKING, SET DRILL PIPE
SLIPS TURN STRING FREED & CIR. FOR 15-MIN. (FOUND TOP DRIVE
BREAKER OFF IN SCR HOUSE )

05:30 - 06:00 0.50 05 CIR. HOLE CLEAN @2527'
12/1/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 02 AIR DRILLED Fl 2527' TO 2622' (95' @95' FPH )WOB 20TO 35 2100 +/- CFM

07:00 - 16:00 9.00 06 MAKED A CONNECTION ATT. TO CIR HOLE PACKED OFF BACK REAM (
SLOWLY TO 2574' UNTIL ESTRABLISH CIR. (TIGHT HOLE @2598' & 2586')

16:00 -19:00 3.00 05 WORK STRING & CIR. HOLE CLEAN @2574'
19:00 - 20:00 1 00 03 REAM BACK TO BOTTOM Fl 2574' TO 2622' (OBSERVED TRONA WATER

FLOW)
20:00 -20:30 0.50 02 ATT. TO DRILL TAG BOTTOM STRING STALLED OUT PICK UP OFF BOTTOM

OBSERVED FOR RETURNS ONLY (WATER NO FOAM RETURNS)
20:30 -00:00 3.50 25 SAFETY MEETING WITH CREW & LINE UP STAND PIPE MANIFOLD ON AIR &

MUD PUMPS ATT. TO PUMP WITH MUD PUMPS (BLOW POP OFF VALVE )
ATT. TO RUN #2 MUD PUMP W/ 80 SPM (PUMP AIR LOCK )WORK ON BOTH
PUMPS REPAIR # 1 MUD PUMP & CIR. WI #2 PUMP THROUGH BLEED OFF
LINE TO TANKS TO GET AIR OUT OF SYSTEM (NOTE: MUD PROBLEM WAS
DUE TO TRYING TO PUMP WATER FROM THE WATER PIT WHICH WASCON.
Wl FOAM (DISCUSS W/ MUD E. TO TRANFER PIT WATER TO TANK #4 AND
TREAT FIRST AND AFTER TRANSFER TO SUCTION TANK

00:00 -06:00 6.00 02 DRILL FI 2670' TO 2830'( 160' @27 FPH )NOTE: TOP DRIVE GETTING HOT
CAUSING TO P/U OFF BOTTOM & RE-SET BREAKER )TOP DRIVE ENG. 1S ON
SITE TROUBLE SHOOTING THE PROBLEM

12/2/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 05 MAKE MOUSEHOLE CONNECTION & ATT. TO CIR HOLE PACKED OFF WORK
STRING ATT. TO ESTABLISH CIR. W. NO SUCCESS
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12/2/2007 10:30 - 17:30 7 00 03 BACK REAM FI 2814' TO 2754' DUMPED S GAL POLYMER, 3 GAL. SOAP
PRESSURED UP TO 1250 PSI W/ AIR

17:30 - 18:00 0 50 05 PIPE CAME FREE & GOT RETURNS CIR HOLE CLEAN WI 194 GPM RESERVE
PIT WATER & 1600 CFM OF AIR @400 PSI WHILE MUDDING UP

18:00 - 20:00 2 00 05 CIR. W/ #2 PUMP @45 SPM AIR 400 CFM STD PIPE 352 PSI
20:00 -20:30 0 50 05 SHUT AIR OFF BROUGHT #1 & #2 PUMPSON LINE @40 SPM 8.4 PPG @352

GPM
20:30 -22:00 1 50 05 GOT RETURNS FLUSHING AIR OUT OF HOLE @PUMPS #1 & #2 @45 SPM

397 GPM
22:00 -03:00 5 00 05 CIR. & RAISE MUD WT
03:00 -06:00 3.00 08 TOP DRIVE STOP ROTATING LOST POWER TO UNIT STILL CIR. HOLE &

RAISE MUD WT.
12/3/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12 00 05 BUILD MUD &CIR. RAISE MUD WT TO 9.2 PPG

18:00 -00:00 6 00 05 CONT.TO CIR. & INCREASE MUD WT TO 9.5 PPG
00:00 -01:30 1 50 06 PUMP PILL TOOH PULLED TIGHT @2445'
01:30 -06:00 4 50 03 BACK REAMING F/ 2445' TO2105'

Printed 12/3/2007 10 38 10
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

10/17/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 03 A DRILL TO 540, RUN 13 3/8 CASING 502'
11:30 - 14:30 3.00 05 H CEMENT SURVFACECASING CREW

11/2/2007 07:00 - 19:00 12.00 01 A RECEIVED 28 LOADS- BOTTOM SUB, 2 LOADS OF MATTING BOARDS, 2 SUB
SPEADERS, BOTH DOG HOUSES, CHOKE MANIFOLD, VOLUME TANK,2 SUIT
CASE SKIDS, BOTH PUMPS, BOTH WATER TANKS, 1 MOTOR, FUELTANK,
HOPPER HOUSE, CATWALK,MIDDLEPIECES OF DERRICK,KOOMYHOUSE,
2 JUCK TUBS, MISC. PIECES TRUCK, PUMP PARTS HOUSE, BOILER,
ANNULAR AND OTHER PIECES. SET MATTINGBOARDS, DRILLER SIDE SUB,
AND PART OF OFF DRILLER SIDE SUB, SET INCHOKE HOUSE ANDSHAKER
PIT (ONLY HAVE 6 HANDSPUTTINGRIG TOGETHER)

19:00 -06:00 11.00 WAIT ON DAY LIGHT TO START TO RIG UP
11/3/2007 07:00 - 19:00 12.00 RECEIVED 13 LOADSTODAYTOP SUB, 3 LOADSOF DERRICK, DRILLING

LINE, WINDWALLS,FLOOR PLATES, BLOCKS, DERRICK STAND, SCR
HOUSE, TOP DRIVE SCR, BOPE (SINGLE, DOUBLE GATE, MUD CROSS), PIPE
RACKS, SUCTION TANK (BAR LINE INSN'T GOING TO WORK TO MUCH
RESRICTION), ALSO GOINGTO RE DO FLOW LINE TO DRILL WITH AIR, SO IT
WON'TWASHOUT 90'S), ----SET TOP SUB ANDSPREADERS SET IN,SET IN
SHKERS, SUCTION TANK(PUTUP ALL HAND RAILSUP), HAVE PUSHER, 2
DRILLERS,4 HANDS)

19:00 - 06:00 11.00 WAITON DAT LIGHT TO SET IN RIG
11/4/2007 07:00 - 19:00 12.00 01 RECEIVEDTOP DRIVE AND PIECES, MOTOR,-SET INLOW PRESSURE

HOUSE, PARTS HOUSE, MUD PUMPS, WINTERIZATION HOUSES, SCR
HOUSE, WATERTANKS, (CAN'T SENT ANY MORE OF PACKAGE#1 MOTOR
HASN'T SHOWED UP YET TOTAL OF MISSING LOADS4- DRAWTOOL,#1
MOTOR, WIRE TRAYANDSOME MISC. LOAD. WORKINGON FLOW LINE TO
DRILL WITH AIR

19:00 - 06:00 11.00 14 E WAIT ON DAY LIGHT
11/5/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A SET IN FLOW LINE, GRASS HOPPER, MOTOR SHEDS, ASSEMBLE DERRICK

(HAVN'TPUT A-LEGS ON YET), SET INOFF DRILLERDOG HOUSE, LIGHT
POLES ANDSHAKESLIDES ON MUD TANKS, PULLCORDS TO GRASS
HOPPER, HAVE TWO FULL CREWS TODAY

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 11 F WAIT ON DAYLIGHTSTO START PUTTINGEQUIPMENTTOGETHER
11/6/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A SET IN FUELTANK, BOILER, GAS BUSTER, DRAWWORKS,PUT A-LEGS ON

DERRICK, ISTALL BRIDEL LINE, KELLYHOSE, FABINGON HOPPER LINES,
TOP DRIVESADDLE, GAS BUSTER RETURN, STAND FOR FLOW LINE,

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 11 F WAITON DAY LIGHT TO RIG UP
11/7/2007 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 01 TIE ON TO DERRICK WITH CRANES AND RAISE DERRICK TO FLOOR, FIRST 2

PINS TOOK 3 HOURS TO PIN (TIGHT HOLEFOR PIN), TRIED TO UN PIN
A-LEGS HAD TO LAY DOWN A LEGS TO GET PINS OUT OF DERRICK,TOOK 1
1/2 HR.S TO PIN 4 PINS ON A- LEGS, 1 HR RAISE DERRICKBOARD AND PIN

15:00 - 18:00 3.00 01 SET INSUIT CASE FOR KOOMY HOUSE, STAIRS AND LANDINGS,SET IN
SOLIDS CONTROL EQUIPMENT ANDBAR HOPPERS, FABBINGLINES FROM
FLOW LINETO BUSTER AND MUD CLEANER

11/8/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A SET IN FLOW EXTENTION,KOOMY HOUSE, HAVINGPROBLEMS WITH
COMMUNICATION WITH SCR HOUSE TO CONTROL PANEL ON FLOOR,(THEY
TOOK THE PANEL THATWAS ON THIS RIG DOWN IN OKC AND PUT ITON A
RIG SOME WHERE ELSE, THIS CONTROL PANEL WAS IN THE CASPER YARD)
FABINGGAS BUSTER LINES, FINISH RIGGINGUP SOLIDS CONTROL, SET IN
REST OF STAIRS, RECEIVED TWO LOADSOF COLLARS,AND PIPE TUB OF
DRILL PIPE,SET REST OF FLOOR PLATES IN, STRUNG UP DERRICK WITH
STRING UP CREW

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 WAIT ON DAY LIGHT TO RIG UP NEW RIG
11/9/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A FOUND PROBLEMINSCR CONTROL PANEL,SPOOL DRILLINGLINE
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/9/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A DRUM ANDCINCHED DOWN ON DEAD MAN, DO DERRICK INSPECTION,
HELD DERRICK OFF STAND, RAISED DERRICK (COULDONLY PIN 1 PIN ON
EACH SIDE- THEY HAD THE SAME PROBLEM ON 327-THE RIG THAT CAME
OUT OF THE YARD BEFORE THIS ONE, ALSO THEY ONLY PINNED TWO PINS
IN OKC YARD) HOOK UP MUDLINEHOSE FROM SHED TO SUB, RAISE
CHOKE MANIFOLD UP ONE HOLE,SET IN FLARE BOX AND PUT HAND RAILS
UP AROUND RIG, FILL WATER TANK WITH WATER(REPAIR WATER LEAKS
(ALOT OF LEAKS),RECEIVED3 LOADSOF PIPE (DON'T HAVEHARD
BANDINGON JT'S OF PIPE)-UNITS HEAD WELDER SHOULD BE HERE
TODAY TO FIX DERRICK PIN HOLES

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 08 E WAIT ON DAY LIGHT TO CONTNUE RIGGING UP
11/10/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 08 COULDN'TGET DERRICK PINNED (HAD TO GET HYDRILICJACKS ANDPUSH

DERRICK OUT TO GET TO PIN). COULDN'T CUT OUT AND WELD DERRICK
EARS WHILE STANDING(UNIT WELDER), GOINGTO CUT OUT EARS ON NEXT
MOVE ANDWELD WHEN DERRICK IS ON GROUND,

11:30 - 15:30 4.00 01 A RUN MUD PUMPS WITH OMRON REP. ON LOCATION, WORK ON STEAM
SYSTEM, RIG UP AIRTUGGERS, UNBRIDLEDDERRICK RECEIVED2 LOADS
OF DRILLPIPE, FINISHED WITH FLOW LINE TO GAS BUSTER LINE, BUILDING
RETURN LINE FROM BUSTER AND TARGET T'S FOR CHOKE LINES,

15:30 - 18:00 2.50 08 LEVELDERRICK HAD TO TAKE 1/2" SHIMS OUT OF OFF DRILLER SIDE AND
PUT IN 2 1/4" OF SHIMS ON DRILLER SIDE (DERRICK WAS 7" TO DRILLER
SIDE AND 4" TOWARD DRAWWORKS)

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 11 F WAIT ON DAYLIGHTS
11/11/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 01 A INSTALLRAILINGFOR BOPE HANDLINGSYSTEM AND CRAWLERS, RIG UP

TONGS, PLACE WIRE LINE MACHINEON FLOOR, CUT BOARDS FOR
RACKINGAREA, RAISE CHOKE MANIFOLD, FABBINGFLARE LINES, GAS
BUSTER VENT LINE,WORK ON STEAM SYSTEM AROUND RIG

13:00 - 20:00 7.00 08 TRY TO CENTER DERRICK OVER WELL, FROM MAIN SUPPORT BRACE TO
TOP OF CRAZYWHEEL BRACE IS 2 1/2 INCHES DIFFERNCE--ODS53 3/4" DS
51 1/4", HAVE2 1/4"SHIMS ON MAINSUPPORTS DRILLERSIDE

20:00 - 06:00 10.00 08 WAIT ON DAY LIGHTS(UNIT SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT, NEEDS WELDER
TO WELD PLATE FOR PORTA POWER TO PICK ADJUSTER LEVEL)

11/12/2007 06:00 -09:30 3.50 08 CENTER BLOCKSOVER WELL,WAS GETTINGCLOSE, WINDBREEZE CAME
UP PUSHING BLOCKS,SO STARTED PICKINGUP TOP DRIVE

09:30 - 18:00 8.50 01 A WELD COMPENSATER PLATESTO BLOCKS, PICK UP SWlVEL,TOP DRIVE
RAIL,

18:00 -06:00 12.00 12 D WAITON DAYLIGHTS
11/13/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A FINISH RIG UP TOP DRIVE RAIL, STRING OUT CORDS AND PUT IN SADDLE,

HANGSADDLE, PICK TOP DRIVE TO FLOOR, INSTALLCOMPENSATOR RAMS,
ANDHOOKUP CONTROLL PANEL,SET IN STEAM HEATERS, SET IN AIR
PACKAGE (BASIC), CONTINUE FABBINGCHOKE MANIFOLD LINES

18:00 - 06:00 12.00 08 E WAIT ON DAY LIGHTS
11/14/2007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 01 A SCREW SWIVEL TO TOP DRIVE, (CHILLER OUT IN TOP DRIVESCR HOUSE),

INSTALL TORQUE BUSHING,STRING CORDS TO TOP DRIVE HOUSE,
09:30 - 14:30 5.00 01 A RIG TOP DRIVE DRILLER CONTROLL PANEL, ASSEMBLE TOP DRIVE

HYDRILICLINES, PUT 10" FLARE LINES TOGETHER, PLUMB DIESEL TO
BOILER, FIRE BO1LER

14:30 - 18:00 3.50 01 A RIG UP TOP DRIVE ELECTRICLINES, INSTAL TURN BUCKLES,CENTER RAIL,
INSTALL FORCED AIR HEATER TUBES, CUT BOARDS FOR RACKINGBOARD

18:00 -06:00 12.00 01 A INSTALL STAND PIPE MANIFOLD,PUT TARP ON TOP DRIVE WIRES,
PRESSURE TEST STEM LINES (F1X LEAKS)TIGHTEN BOLTS ON STAND PIPE,

11/15/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 01 A PUT UNION ON SWIVEL(NEED TO BUILD GOOSE NECK TO HOLD HOSE

Printed: 1/3/2008 7:59:17
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Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/15/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 01 A AWAY FROM UNIT),LAY OUT 4" FLARE LINES, SWITCH AROUND HYDRILIC
LINE AND ANTI FREEZE (BOTH ARE CONTAMINATED),TOP DRIVEBLEWA
SEAL IN INTENSIFIER

11:00 - 15:00 4.00 01 A SET IN 400 BBL TANK FOR NACLWATER AND UNLOAD 500 BBL ROLL TANKS
FOR INVERT,CUT CONDUCTORAND HAMMEROFF CEMENT,RIG UP
HYDRALIC LINES TO BOPE LIFT

15:00 - 16:30 1.50 08 RE-TEST INTENSIFIER (REBUILT SEALS LEAKED STILL)
16:30 -18:00 1.50 14 MAKEFINALCUT AND TWO HOLE WELLHEAD WITH CAMERON, LEVELHEAD

ANDWELD HEAD,FABBINGFINISHEDGAS BUSTER RETURN, ALMOSTDONE
WITH 4" LINES,

18:00 - 20:00 2.00 08 E STRETCH PIT LINER OUT FOR INVERT TANKS
20:00 - 22:30 2.50 14 .STACK SINGLE GATE AND MUD CROSS AND DOUBLE GATE
22:30 -06:00 7.50 08 WAIT ON TOP DRIVE UNIT-INSTALL FLOOR MATSAND FRONT WIND WALLS,

HOOK UP STEAM HEATER ON RIG FLOOR, CLEAN OUT TRASH OUT OF MUD
TANKS,

11/16/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 08 RIG UP REMOTE KOOMY LINE AND AIR LINE
07:30 - 10:30 3.00 08 RIG UP AND TORQUE SWIVEL AND TOP DRIVE
10:30 - 12:00 1.50 08 SET 500 BBLINVERT MUD TANKS
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 08 REPAIR EATON WATER COOLINGSYSTEM
13:30 - 15:00 1.50 08 DISASSMBLE PUMP SKID OFF OF TOP DRIVE UNIT
15:00 - 18:00 3.00 08 HOOK UP FLARE LINES, MAKE UP HYDRILICLINES FOR BOPE, START TIGOA

FORCED AIR HEATER, AND GEL MUD TANK GATES
18:00 - 20:00 2.00 08 RIG UP STEAM LINES IN PUMP SHED ,INSTALL HYDRAULICFITTINGSON

BOPE FOR KOOMY
20:00 -23:00 3.00 08 CHANGE OUT TOP DRIVE CHILLER UNIT WITH BOOMTRUCK
23:00 -00:00 1.00 08 FINISH HOOKINGUP STEAM LINES IN PUMP SHED, BUILD BURM AROUND

INVERTSTORAGE TANKS I
00:00 -03:00 3.00 08 CHANGE HOOKS ON TONG HANGING LINES,AND ADD WEIGHT TO

COUNTER WEIGHTS
03:00 - 06:00 3.00 08 ROLL UP PIT LINEER, RIG UP DRILLRSSTEAM HEATER, WORK ON COLLING

LEAK ON DRAW WORKS, HANGBAILSON TOP DRIVE
06:00 -

11/17/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 08 BREAKOUT UNION OUT OF SWlVELlWORK ON COOLANT LINESON
DRAW-WORKS

08:00 - 14:00 6.00 08 HELP WELDERS ON FLARE LINESAND BUILDBLOWDOWN LINE ON BOILER
14:00 - 18:00 4.00 14 PICK UP ANNULAR, BLEW HOSE ON SNUBBINGIN TRUCK (BOP LIFT SYSTEM

WON'T PICK UP ANN.),SNUBBINGTRUCK BLEWHYDRILICLINE
18:00 - 03:00 9.00 14 INSTALL SPACER SPOOL AND ROT.HEAD,HAD B.C QUICK TEST TORQUE

ALLCONECTIONS, PUT OIL IN KOOMY,AND CONNECT KOOMYLINES, FILL
MUD TANKS HALF FULL AND INSTALL WALK WAYS IN SUB (SCAFOLDING)

03:00 - 06:00 3.00 01 A PUT BRACE IN FOR TOP DRIVE RAIL AND PICK UP TOOLS AROUND RIG
11/18/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 01 A PUT ELECTIRlC MOTOR ON AGITATOR, TEST ALL MUD LINES (FIX LEAKS),

AND CHECKED ALL AGITATORS
07:00 - 15:00 8.00 14 PUT CHOKE LINE IN (NOT TIGHT), CHANGE AROUNDBLIND AND PIPE RAMS,

FUNCTION TEST RAMS
15:00 - 18:00 3.00 01 A HOOK UP KELLY HOSE ADJUST TRACK, PUT VALVE IN FLOW LINE FOR TRIP

TANK RETURN, UNLOAD MUD PRODUCTS,
18:00 -21:00 3.00 01 A STRAIGHTEN UPTOPTRACK IN DERRRICK,
21:00 - 03:00 6.00 01 A HOOK UP FILLUP IN LINE, STAND PlPE, GAUGE ELEVATORS,GROUND

BUILDINGS, BRINGSUBS TO RIG FLOOR, BUILD LINE AND HANGNG CABLES
FOR MUD BOX, BUILD LINE AND HANG PIPE SPINNERS,

03:00 -06:00 3.00 01 A BUILD BLEED OFF LINEON #2 MUDPUMP, ---WELD FABBED1
EXTENTION-SLIDE FOR SHAKERS, FINISHED CELLER GRATTING,

Printed: 1/3/2008 7:59:17



Questar E & P Page 4 of 14

Operations Summary Report
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Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Su Description of Operations

11/19/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 01 A PUT SAFETY LINE ON TOP DRIVE SERVICE LOOP INDERRICK
07:00 - 09:00 2.00 01 A MOVESCAFOLDINGFOR WELDER, PULLFLOOR PLATE ANDPREPARE TO

LOWER BOP HANDLINGRAIL
09:00 - 12:30 3.50 08 FIX COOLANT LINE ON TOP DRIVE
12:30 - 13:30 1.00 01 A ADJUST COUNTER BALANCE ON TOP DRIVE
13:30 - 15:30 2.00 01 A LOWER BOP HANDLINGRAIL AND LOAD OUT KELLYPIECES
15:30 - 18:00 2.50 01 A RE SET ROTATINGHEAD AND SPACER SPOOL (TURN WHERE IT WOULD

FACE STRAIGHT
18:00 - 21:00 3.00 01 A FINISH TIGHENINGROTATINGHEAD AND ADJUST TOP DRIVE TRACK
21:00 -21:30 0.50 01 A GET MEASURE MENT OF BOPE EQUIPMENT, ANDRIG UP GERONIMOLINE
21:30 - 00:00 2.50 01 A MAKE CABLESTO CENTER BOPE, RIG UP CABLES IN SUB, PULL BOPE TO

CENTER
00:00 - 02:30 2.50 01 A RIG UP PULLEY IN DERRRICK FOR WIRE LINE MACHINE, AND PULL CORD
02:30 -04:30 2.00 01 A SET IN YELLOW DOGS AND RUN POWER CORDS
04:30 -05:30 1.00 01 A ADJUST COUNTRER WEIGHT ON DERRRICKCLIMBER
05:30 -06:00 0.50 01 A CHECK ALL SAFETY EQUIPMENT, AND FILL, UNLOAD WESTERN CHEMICAL

BARRELS
11/20/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A HOOK UP GERONIMOLINE, HELP WELDERS INSTALL ORBIT VALVE, TAKE

OUT SCM BOARD IN TOP DRIVEHOUSE AND TROUBLESHOOT COM
BOARDS IN TOP DRIVE HOUSE, HOOK UP PASON AND INTER COM TO
DERRICK, RIG UP YELLOW DOG, AND ROLL #2 MUD PUMP CHECK OILING IN
PUMP CHECKED O.K.

18:00 - 21:00 3.00 01 A PRESSURE TEST MUD LINESTO 1000 PSI FIX LEAKS,TIGHTEN CAPS ON
PUNPS, UNIONS, ECT.

21:00 -23:00 2.00 01 A BUILD ROTATINGMANIFOLD, HOOK UP OILER BOX AND HOOK UP FILLUP
LINES

23:00 - 00:00 1.00 01 A REPLACE SHElVE ON BOPE SNUB, AND RIG UP AND BLOWDOWN KELLY
HOSE

00:00 -02:30 2.50 01 A PUT 6" DRAININ BOTTOM OF GAS BUSTER, TURN FLAPPER INVENT LINE,
AND INSTALL BOLTS IN FLANGES INBUSTER

02:30 -04:00 1.50 01 A ADD GROUND RODS AND CABLES WHERE NEEDED AROUND RIG, BUILD
HOESE FOR TRIP TANK

04:00 - 06:00 2.00 01 A RE ADJUST GERONIMO LINE, REBUILD AIR MANIFOLD, BLOW DOWN MUD
LINESTHRU PUMPS, REPLACE LAYDOWNLINE,CLEANAND PUT AWAY
TOOLS,WELD-- FLOW LINE FINISHED, HAVE BAR LINE ON TANKS,AND
TROUGHS TO BUILD TO PIT, SAFETY ITEMSAROUND RIG

11/21/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A HOOK UP LINE FOR TRIP TANK, AND INSTALL COM, CHECK OIL LEVELS IN
PUMPS, ANDDRAW-WORKS,INSTALLRETURNLINES IN FLARE BOX, MAKE
UP BAR MANIFOLD, RIG UP AIR FOR AIR JAMMERS, REPLACED ECM BOARD
IN TOP DRIVE HOUSE, WORK ON TOP DRIVECOUNTER BALANCE, INSTALL
FOOTINGON WELL HEAD (READY TO CEMENT CELLER)

18:00 - 21:30 3.50 01 A PUT DIFFERNTSIZE CABLE ON BOPE CENTERING,AND SNUB CENTER AND
PUT UP SUB TARP AND INSTALL PASON EQUIPMENT ON THE END OF DRUM
SHAFT

21:30 -23:00 1.50 01 A BUILD DIRT BURM OVER GAS BUSTER LINES AND INSTALL TARGET T ON
THE END OF FLOW LINE AND INSTALL DIFFERNT TROUGHS FOR CENTER
FUGES AND PUT DRAIN ON GAS BUSTER

23:00 - 01:30 2.50 01 A INSTALLMOUSE HOLEAND FIND BHA X-OVERS AND PICK TO RIG FLOOR
AND RE PLUMB T-BLOCK ON CHOKE MANIFOLD TO

01:30 -03:00 1.50 01 A REPAIR STEM LEAKSAROUND RIG AND PICK UP TRASH AND TOOLS
AROUNDRIG,

03:00 -06:00 3.00 01 A RACK BHA ANDSTRAP AND HOUSE KEEPINGAROUND RIG
11/22/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00 01 A (CALLED AND NOTIFIED BLM OF BOP TEST- RAY ARNOLD) FUNCTION TEST
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Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - T Hours Code Description of Operations

11/22/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00 01 A BOPS REPAIR HYD. LEAKSFILL BOTTOM OF CELLAR W/ CMT TO BASE RING,
CALB.PASON MUD VOLUMESYSTEM WITH MUD TANKS,ADJUST LINKTILT
ON TOP DRIVE, START RIGGINGUP YELLOW DOGS TO PUMP WATER FROM
UP RIGHT TANKSOR WAIST PIT & FAB. & INSTALL SHAKER CUTTINGSLIDES
CONT. TO FRAB. & INSTALL BARITE LINESON SUCTION TANKSINSTALL
ROT. MOUSE HOLE

14:00 - 18:00 4.00 01 A RIG UP & P/UP TESTING EQUIPMENT
18:00 - 06:00 12.00 08 D P/T BOPS ATT.TOTEST UPPER RAMSOBSERVE LOWER RAMS LEAKING@

DOOR REPLACE DAMAGED BONNET RUBBERS ATT.TO TEST U.RAMSBLIND
RAMS LEAKING@DOORS RE-TIGHTENBONNETBOLTS &RETEST SAME
LEAK ATT. PULL OUT TEST JOINT DRAWWORKSWOULD NOT WORK SHUT
OFF POWER & RE-BOOT SYSTEM STILL NOT OPERATING CALLED UNIT
TECHNICIAN& ELE. DISCUSS OVER PHONE THE PROBLEM THEY WAS
UNABLE TO FIX PROBLEM OVER THE PHONE AT THE MOMENT THE
TECHICANAND ELE. IS IN ROUTE TO THE RIG SITE.

11/23/2007 06:00 - 18:30 12.50 08 WAIT ON UNITS ELECTRICAN ARRIVED @1330 HRS TROUBLE SHOOT
FOUND LOOSE CONNECTION TO POWER SUPPLY GOING TO DRILLER
CONSOLE SWITCH PANEL ( DC MODULE WAS NOT GETTINGPOWER )

18:30 - 22:30 4.00 08 D PULL OUT TEST JOINT &CHANGE OUT BONNET SEAL RUBBERS ON BLIND
RAMS DOORS.

22:30 - 03:00 4.50 15 TEST BOPS ANN. LOW 250 PSI HIGH TEST 3500 PSI, ALL RELATED BOPS &
EQUIPMENT TESTED WI LOW 250 PSI & HIGH 5000 PSI (SHELL TESTED
BOPS &CHOKE MANIFOLD TO 10000 PSI ) P/TEST SUFACE CASING 1500 PSI

03:00 - 06:00 3.00 19 C PICK UP BHA &NEW DRILL PIPE
11/24/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 08 ATTEMPT TO TORQUE UP BHACONNECTIONS MlUP TONG LINE ON CAT

HEAD WAS TO LONG RECUT &ATT. TO TORQUE UP FIRST CONNECTION
BLOW HYDRAULICHOSE ON M/UP CAT HEAD CYLINDER REPLACE HYD.
HOSE

11:00 - 15:00 4.00 06 J MlUP BIT ON NEW SUBS &COLLARS( M/UP & BREAK OUT NEW
CONNECTION TWICE DUE TO NEW BHA)

15:00 - 03:00 12.00 06 P/UP NEW DRILL PIPE TORQUE UP BREAK LOOSE & RE-TORQUE ALL
CONNECTION(TOTAL DRILLPIPE P/UP & 1NDERRICK2104')

03:00 - 06:00 3.00 08 DRAWWORKSSTOP WORKING( LOST POWER SUPPLY TO DC MODULE )
11/25/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00 08 REPAIR DRAWWORKSLOST POWER TO DC MODULE

14:00 - 06:00 16.00 06 P/UP NEW 5' DRILL PIPE TORQUE UP & BREAK OUT & RE-TORGUE ALL
CONNECT.
AND RACK BACK IN DERRICK (TOTAL 53 STDS IN DERRICK )

11/26/2007 06:00 -20:00 14.00 06 PICK UP NEW HWDP &TORQUE UP & BREAK OUT & M/UP RIH WI 12 1/4 BHA
TAG TOP OF CMT. 469'

20:00 - 21:00 1.00 25 DRILLOUT CMT. FI 469' TO TOP OF L/C@476' BRAKESSYSTEM NOT
WORKINGUNABLE TO MAINTAIN CORRECT BIT WT

21:00 - 06:00 9.00 08 ATT. TO WORKSTRING AND ADJUST AIR RELAY VALVE TO CONTROL DRILL
STRING SPEED ( CALL UNITSSUP. & MECH.) WAIT ON MECH.

11/27/2007 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 08 ON UNITSTIME ( DRAWWORKSNOT WORKINGPROPERLY BRAKES NOT
HOLDINGTROUBLE SHOOT FOR THE PAST 24 HOURS WITH RIG SUP. &
TOOLPUSHER REPLACE HYD HOSES THAT WAS LEAKINGGOINGTO HYD.
BRAKE CONTROL & BOTH AIR RELAY VALVE&CONTROL VALVE ON
DRILLER CONSOLE ATT. TO WORK STRING STILL BRAKE NOT HOLDING
STRING WT PROPERLY ( WAIT ON UNITSHEADMECHANIC)

11/28/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 08 REPAIR DRAWWORKS- REMOVE QUICK RELEASE @EATON BRAKE TO
STOP AIR FROM DUMPINGQUICKLY PER EATONS RECOMONDATION WHICH
WAS CAUSING THE BRAKE TO OPERATE ERRATICLY REPLACED H-4 VALVE
REPLACED RELAY VALVE , EXTENDED BRAKE HANDLE 6"
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11/28/2007 13:00 - 15:30 2.50 02 D DRILL OUT SHOE TRACK & 15' 12 1/4 HOLE
15:30 -16:00 0.50 08 E FIT EQUIVALENTTEST TO 10.5 PPG
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 25 HOLD SAFETY MEETINGWl BASIC AIR CREW &RIG CREWS
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 05 A DRILL OUT RAT HOLE Fl SHOE TO 540'
18:00 - 18:30 0.50 25 HOLD SAFETY MEETINGW/ BASICAIR CREW &RIG CREWS
18:30 - 22:30 4.00 03 A DRILL FI 540' TO 676' ( 136' @34' FPH )2000 +/- CFM, ATT. TO MAINTAIN20

WOB
22:30 - 23:00 0.50 25 STOP DRILLINGPICK UP &WORK ON BASIC(AIR ) PUMP
23:00 - 02:30 3.50 03 A DRILL Fl 676' TO 817' ( 141' @41' FPH )2000+/- CFM WOB 20
02:30 - 03:00 0.50 25 PICK UP &WORK ON BASIC(AIR ) PUMP
03:00 - 06:00 3.00 03 A DRILL FI 817' TO 940' ( 123' @ 41' FPH )2000 +/- CFM WOB 20

11/29/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50 03 A DRILL FI940' TO 1284' ( 344' @45.8' FPH )WOB 15-20 CFM 1950 +/-

13:30 - 16:00 2.50 05 CIR. HOLE CLEAN FLOW LINE & FLARE BOX FULL OF CUTTINGREMOVE
CUTTING

16:00 - 06:00 14.00 03 A DRILL FI 1284' TO 1820' ( 536' @ 38.2' FPH )WOB 10 CFM 2000 +/-

11/30/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 02 DRILL Fl 1815' TO 1861' (46' @30.6 FPH )WOB 15 2000 +/- CFM
07:30 - 10:00 2.50 06 TRIP TO 1420'
10:00 - 12:00 2.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE REAMEDLAST TWO STDS
12:00 - 18:00 6.00 02 AIR DRILL 12 1/4" HOLE FI 1861' TO 2085' ( 224' @37.3 )WOB 15 2000 +/- CFM
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 02 AIR DRILL 12 1/4" HOLE Fl 2085' TO 2149' ( 64' @64') WOB 25-34 2000 +/- CFM
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 02 RIG SERVICE
20:00 - 00:00 4.00 02 AIR DRILL 12 1/4" HOLE F/ 2149' TO 2384' ( 235' @59') WOB 22-32 2000 +/-

CFM
00:00 - 01:00 1.00 08 E STOP DRILLING BOLT FELL OUT OF DERRICK ( INSPECTED DERRICKFOUND

BOLT WORK LOOSE ON TOP DRIVE RAIL) TOP CLAMP INSTALL BOLT
TORQUE SAMEAND FOUND TO MORE LOOSE ON CLAMP

01:00 - 04:30 3.50 03 A AIR DRILL2384' TO 2527' ( 143' @41') WOB 20- 32 2000 +/- CFM
04:30 - 05:30 1.00 02 MAKE CONNECTION ATT. TO CIR. HOLE PACKED OFF, BLEED PRESSURE

OFF ATT. TO ROTATE STRING TOP DRIVESTOP WORKING,SET DRILL PIPE
SLIPS TURN STRING FREED & CIR. FOR 15-MIN. ( FOUND TOP DRIVE
BREAKER OFF IN SCR HOUSE )

05:30 - 06:00 0.50 05 CIR. HOLECLEAN @2527'
12/1/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 02 AIR DRILLED FI2527' TO 2622' ( 95' @95' FPH )WOB 20TO 35 2100 +/- CFM

07:00 - 16:00 9.00 06 MAKED A CONNECTION ATT. TO CIR HOLE PACKED OFF BACK REAM (
SLOWLY TO 2574' UNTIL ESTRABLISH CIR. (TIGHT HOLE @2598' &2586')

16:00 - 19:00 3.00 05 WORK STRING &CIR. HOLE CLEAN @2574'
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 03 REAM BACKTO BOTTOM FI2574' TO 2622' ( OBSERVED TRONA WATER

FLOW )
20:00 - 20:30 0.50 02 ATT. TO DRILL TAG BOTTOM STRING STALLED OUT PICK UP OFF BOTTOM

OBSERVED FOR RETURNS ONLY (WATER NO FOAMRETURNS )
20:30 - 00:00 3.50 25 SAFETY MEETINGWITH CREW & LINE UP STAND PIPE MANIFOLD ON AIR &

MUD PUMPS ATT. TO PUMP WITH MUD PUMPS ( BLOW POP OFF VALVE )
ATT. TO RUN # 2 MUD PUMP W/ 80 SPM ( PUMP AIR LOCK )WORK ON BOTH
PUMPS REPAIR # 1 MUD PUMP &CIR. WI #2 PUMP THROUGH BLEED OFF
LINE TO TANKS TO GET AIR OUT OF SYSTEM ( NOTE: MUD PROBLEM WAS
DUE TO TRYINGTO PUMP WATER FROM THE WATER PIT WHICH WAS CON.
WI FOAM ( DISCUSS WI MUD E. TO TRANFER PIT WATER TO TANK #4 AND
TREAT FIRST ANDAFTER TRANSFER TO SUCTION TANK

00:00 - 06:00 6.00 02 DRILL FI 2670' TO 2830' ( 160' @ 27' FPH ) NOTE: TOP DRIVE GETTINGHOT
CAUSINGTO P/U OFF BOTTOM & RE-SET BREAKER )TOP DRIVE ENG. IS ON
SITE TROUBLE SHOOTING THE PROBLEM

12/2/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 05 MAKE MOUSEHOLECONNECTION &ATT. TO CIR HOLE PACKED OFF WORK
STRING ATT. TO ESTABLISH CIR. W. NO SUCCESS
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code S Description of Operations

12/2/2007 10:30 - 17:30 7.00 03 BACK REAM Fl 2814' TO 2754' DUMPED 5 GAL POLYMER, 3 GAL. SOAP
PRESSURED UP TO 1250 PSI WI AIR

17:30 - 18:00 0.50 05 PlPE CAME FREE & GOT RETURNS CIR HOLE CLEAN W/ 194 GPM RESERVE
PIT WATER& 1600 CFM OF AIR @400 PSI WHILE MUDDINGUP

18:00 -20:00 2.00 05 CIR. W/ #2 PUMP @45 SPM AIR 400 CFM STD PIPE 352 PSI
20:00 - 20:30 0.50 05 SHUT AIR OFF BROUGHT # 1 &#2 PUMPS ON LINE @40 SPM 8.4 PPG @352

GPM
20:30 - 22:00 1.50 05 GOT RETURNS FLUSHING AIR OUT OF HOLE @ PUMPS # 1 &#2 @ 45 SPM

397 GPM
22:00 - 03:00 5.00 05 CIR. &RAISE MUD WT
03:00 -06:00 3.00 08 TOP DRIVE STOP ROTATINGLOST POWER TO UNITSTILL CIR. HOLE&

RAISE MUD WT.
12/3/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 05 BUILD MUD &CIR. RAISE MUD WT TO 9.2 PPG

18:00 - 00:00 6.00 05 CONT.TO CIR. & INCREASE MUDWT TO 9.5 PPG
00:00 - 01:30 1.50 06 PUMP PILL TOOH PULLED TIGHT @2445'
01:30 - 06:00 4.50 03 BACK REAMING Fl 2445' TO 2105'

12/4/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 03 BACKREAMINGF/2121' TO 2048' ( PIPE STUCK @2048')
07:30 -09:30 2.00 03 PIPE GOT STUCK WORK STUCK PIPE JAR DOWN ON PIPE FREE PIPE
09:30 - 18:00 8.50 03 BACK REAMINGF/ 2048' TO 1365' ( NOTE: USINGVERY HIGH HYD.

PRESSURE TO BREAK OUT CONNECTIONS )
18:00 - 21:30 3.50 03 BACKREAMINGFl 1365' TO CASING SHOE FLOW CHECK - OK
21:30 - 23:00 1.50 06 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO SURFACE
23:00 - 00:00 1.00 06 J LAY DOWN IBS & BREAK OUT 12 1/4 BIT
00:00 - 06:00 6.00 08 REPAIR DRAWWORKS ( EATON BRAKE PISTON SYSTEM )

12/5/2007 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 08 WORK ON EATON BRAKE
06:30 - 10:00 3.50 06 TRIP IN HOLE W/ NEW 12 1/4 BITTAG RESISTANCE @565'
10:00 - 00:00 14.00 03 WASH & REAM FI 565' TO 2749'
00:00 -02:30 2.50 05 CIR. & CLEAN HOLE PUMPING SWEEPS FOR SURVEY
02:30 - 03:00 0.50 10 SURVEY @2648' 1/4* DEG. DIR. 351.3 TVD @2648'
03:00 - 05:00 2.00 03 WASH &REAMFI2749' TO BOTTOM @2830'
05:00 - 06:00 1.00 02 DRILL Fl 2830' TO 2870' (40' @40' FPH )WOB 25 RPM 120

12/6/2007 06:00 - 09:30 3.50 03 A DRILL FROM 2862 TO 2902 (ROP 11.4' HR)(LOST POWER TO RIG-COULDN'T
CIRCULATE, ROT, PICK UP OFF BOTTOM)

09:30 - 10:30 1.00 08 REPAIR BLOWN FUSE IN PLC PANEL IN SCR AND BLOWN FUSE IN DRILLER
CONSOLE

10:30 - 13:30 3.00 03 BACKREAMFROM 2902 TO 2850/ PACKEDOFF ANDCOULDN'TCIRCULATE
LOST APROX. 300 BBL.S TO TRYINGTO CIRCULATE, REGAINED
CIRCULATION

13:30 - 14:00 0.50 25 RE INSTALL ROTATINGHEAD, PULLED THRU FLOOR WHEN BACK REAMING
14:00 - 15:30 1.50 05 CIRCULATE WITH #2 PUMP WORK PIPE TO BOTTOM AND REPAIR POP OFF

ON #1 PUMP
15:30 - 20:00 4.50 02 DRILLFROM 2902 TO 2962 (ROP 13.3' HR) WOB 20-30, DIFFERNTROT.

SPEEDS,
20:00 - 21:00 1.00 08 CIRCULATE AND TIGHTEN TURN BUCKLES IN DERRICK TORQUE TUBE

SWAYINGALOTNEED TO PUT MORE TURN BUCKLES,TO STIFFEN THE
TORQUE TUBE UP

21:00 -06:00 9.00 02 DRILL FROM2962 TO 3075 (ROP 12' HR) CUT BACK ON PUMP STROKES
STARTED LOSSING MUD 50 BBLS HR. BEEN PUMPING 15% LCM SWEEPS
REGAIN ALLMOST TOTAL RETURNS (TOTAL LOSSES 350 BBLS)

12/7/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 02 DRILL FROM 3075 TO 3151
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 07 RIG SERVICE (TOP DRIVE AND BLOCKSAND SWIVEL)
11:00 -13:30 2.50 02 DRILL FROM 3131 TO 3154, HADEXESIVE TORQUE, WHEN BUILDINGPILL TO

TRIP OUT, ALL RETURNS-THE BRAKE DOES SLACKS OFF GOOD FOR A
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

12/7/2007 11:00 - 13:30 2.50 02 WHILE(COUPLE HR.S, THEN QUITS TOTALY THEN WHEN DRILLER GOES TO
ADJUST AIRCONTROL REGULATER IT SLACKS OFF 20K-30K OVER DISIRED
WOB

13:30 - 20:00 6.50 05 C LOST CIRCULATION PULLED AND RACKED BACK ONE STAND, WORK PIPE
AND BUILD AND PUMP 15% LCMSWEEP (100 BBL), REGAIN PARTAIL
RETURNS, PUMPED 35% LCM SWEEP AND REGAINED RETURNS--HOLE
TOOK 1500 BBLDRINK, BUILDVOLUMETO TRIP OUT

20:00 -21:30 1.50 05 CIRCULATE WHILE BUILDINGPILL FOR TRIP, HAD PROBLEMS WITH VALVES
AND WITH PUMPS FOR HOPPERS, BUILD 1#OVER PILL

21:30 - 22:00 0.50 10 DROP SURVEY @3035 .3 DEG, 306.9
22:00 -22:30 0.50 06 TRIP OUT OF HOLE 5 STANDS (HOLE CLEANNO OVER PULL) TO CHANGE

BIT TO PICK UP HC- 605 AND MUD MOTOR
22:30 -23:00 0.50 25 PULL ROTATINGHEAD, AND BLOW DOWN KELLY HOSE
23:00 - 03:00 4.00 06 A TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT TIGHT FORM 2403-2219, 1390-1207 AND REST

OF THE WAYOUT OF THE HOLE HAD ALOT OF DRAG
03:00 -04:30 1.50 06 A HANDLE BHA LAY DOWN BIT SUB AND BIT,PICK UP MUDMOTOR (HUNTING

.24) AND NEW BIT
04:30 - 06:00 1.50 06 A TRIP INHOLE WITH NEW BIT

12/8/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 06 A TRIP IN HOLE WITHNEW BIT TAGGED BRIDGE @2219 TO 2260 WASHED
THRU

10:00 - 10:30 0.50 03 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 3071 TO 3154 (5' FILL)
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 02 DRILL FROM 3154 TO 3166 -TRY TO WORK WITH AUTO DRILLER

PERAMETERS SO DRAW WORKS WOULDN'T DUMP WEIGHT ON BIT TRYlNG
TO HOLD 5K ON BIT- GETTING 12-15K BRAKELETS OUT TO MUCH DRILLING
LINE WHEN BRAKE HANDLE JACKS OFF

11:30 - 12:00 0.50 07 SERVICE TOP DRIVE AND BLOCKS, CROWN, SWIVEL
12:00 - 17:00 5.00 02 DRILL FROM3166-3219 WORKINGDIFFERNT PERAMETERS WITH BRAKE

HANDLE, ALSO PUSHER TALKED TO HEAD MECHANIC IN OKC (MIKE
ALMOND)-WE CHECKED TO SEE IF HYDRILICBRAKESWERE BLEEDING
OFF(PRESSURES GOOD), TRIED TO LET THE CONTROL HANDLETAKE
MORE OF THE WEIGHTBY AJUSTING H4-VALVE, TRIED PUTTINGBRAKE IN
25%(NOT HOLDINGENOUGHWITHH4 VALVE-BRAKE),75%(WHATWE HAVE
BEEN DRILLING WITH), 100% (WOULDN'T SLACKANY WEIGHT OFF), HAND
DRILLED- WORKED THE BEST KEPT WITH IN 3K OF DESIRED WEIGHT

17:00 - 19:00 2.00 08 DRILLBY HAND AND AUTO DRILLER WITH UNITSUPT. (ED PHELPS) ON
FLOOR SO HE COULDOBSERVE WHATSGOING ON WITH THE BRAKE, (WE
DISCOVERED THAT THE BRAKE HANDLE HASTO BE IN A HIGHER POSTION
TO LETOFF WEIGHTDRILL STRING THAN180 DEG. ON DRUM(SEEMS THAT
SOMETHINGMIGHT BE DRAGGINGOR OUT OF BALANCE-BUT THERE ISN'T
ALOT OF VIBIRATION WHENTRIPPING)

19:00 - 23:00 4.00 06 TRIPPING TO SHOE TO WORK ON BRAKESSO THATWE CAN HOLD A
CONSTANTW.O.B. (MECHANICSON THERE WAY FROM PINEDALEAREA-
SHOULD BE HERE THIS A.M.

23:00 - 06:00 7.00 08 WAITON MECHANICTO LOOKOVER BRAKES,ARRIVED ON LOCATION@4
AM, MECHANICLOOKING OVER HYDRIL IC BRAKE SYSTEM-MECHANIC
ARRIVED@4 AM

12/9/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 08 TIGHTEN AIR LEAKSON EATONBRAKE, ON 25% HADA BAD LEAK, 75% HAD
2 LEAKS REAL SMALL/ RE-POSTION BRAKEHANDLE

07:00 - 08:00 1.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE TO 1,210 TAGGED SOlLD-HAD PEA GRAVEL COMING BACK
WHEN WASHINGTHRU

08:00 - 09:00 1.00 03 WASH AND REAM FROM 1,210 TO 1,245 WORKED THRU SPOT
09:00 - 10:30 1.50 06 TRIP IN TO 3,144 TRIP WAS GOOD (HOLE CLEAN)
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 03 SAFETY WASH FROM 1,245 TO 3,219 HAD 5' FILL
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

12/9/2007 11:00 - 12:00 1.00 08 WORK WITH AIR BRAKE TO SEE IF IT WOULD HOLD CONSTANT WEIGHT
AND SLACKOFF LINECONSISTANT TRIED DIFFERENT SETTINGS WORKED
BEST (BRAKE 25% WITH 35 PSI ON H-4 VALVE)

12:00 - 14:30 2.50 02 DRILL FROM 3,219 TO 3,261 (ROP 16.8) WOB 3-6, ROT 30-40, SPM 75/75,
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 08 CHANGE OUT BRAKE RELEASE VALVE (PER UNIT SUPT.)
15:00 - 20:00 5.00 02 DRILL FROM 3261 TO 3,357(ROP 19.2 HR) ,STARTED @ 3295 SEEPING 10

BBLSAN HOUR, PUMPING 15% LCMSWEEPS (20 BBLS) EVERYHOUR -

PIPE SHIMMERING-NO TORQUE SHOWING ON TOP DRIVE CONSOLE, AND
NO VISUL VERTICAL BOUNCE ON SURFACE-SHAKES DERRICK-GOINGTO
CHECK TOP DRIVE ON CONNECTION

20:00 - 21:00 1.00 07 WORK ON TOP DRIVE CABLES- MAKE SURE ALL CABLES ARE
TIGHT(CHECKEDOK), CHECK TIMINGOF TOP DRIVE MOTORS (CHECKED
OK), OPENED TOP DRIVE CONTROL BOX AND FOUND SOME LOOSE
WIRES-TOP DRIVE DON'T SHIMMER ANY MORE

21:00 - 04:30 7.50 02 DRILL FROM 3,357 TO 3,519( ROP 21.6' HR) HOLE HASN'T TAKEN ANY FLUID
SINCE 3,332

04:30 - 05:00 0.50 25 CLEAN SUCTION SCREEN ON #1 PUMP
05:00 - 05:30 0.50 25 CLEAN SUCTION SCREEN ON #2 PUMP
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 02 DRILL FROM 3519 TO 3530 (ROP 20' HR) WOB 7, ROT 40, SPM 75/75, NO

LOSSES, BG GAS 15,
12/10/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 02 DRILL FROM 3530 TO 3643 (ROP 22.6' HR) WOB 5-6, ROT 40-50, SPM 85/85,BG

GAS 42 UNITS, SHAKERS STILL BY PASSED , VERY MINIMAL PEA GRAVEL
COMINGTO SHAKERS,

11:00 - 12:00 1.00 11 SURVEY @3565 .3 DEG 231 AZ
12:00 - 16:30 4.50 02 DRILL FROM 3643 TO 3743 (ROP 22.2) SAME PERRAMETERS, PULL SUCTION

SCREENS OUTI PACKINGOFF WITH NUT PLUG
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 07 SERVICE RIG, GREASE BLOCK,SWIVEL, TOP-DRIVE
17:00 - 06:00 13.00 02 DRILL FROM 3743 TO 4005 (ROP 20.1) WORK DIFFERNT PERAMETERS HOLE

SEEPING @ 10 BBL HR
12/11/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00 02 DRILLINGFROM 4005 TO 4120 (ROP 14.4' HR)

14:00 - 14:30 0.50 07 RIG SERVICE (TOPDRIVE, BLOCKS,SWlVEL, CROWN)
14:30 -23:30 9.00 02 DRILLFROM4120 TO 4311 (ROP 21.2)
23:30 - 00:30 1.00 10 CIRCULATE AND SURVEY .3 DEG 5.1 AZ
00:30 - 02:00 1.50 02 DRILL FROM 4311 TO 4327 (ROP 10.6) HADHIGH PUMP PRESSURE AFTER

CONNECTION

02:00 - 02:30 0.50 05 CIRCULATE WELL AND BUILD TRIP SLUG
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 06 PUMP TRIP SLUG AND TRIP OUT OF HOLE, PULL 5 STANDS, BLOW DOWN

KELLY HOSE AND PULL ROT. RUBBER, HAD TO BACK REAM FROM 1207 TO
1185

12/12/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 06 A TRIP OUT HOLE TO CHANGE OUT BIT AND MUD MOTOR
08:00 - 09:30 1.50 06 J BREAKBITAND LAYDOWN MUD MOTOR (HUNTING.24) AND PICK UP

MOTOR (HUNTING.16) AND BIT
09:30 - 10:00 0.50 06 TRIP IN TO SHOE (502')
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 08 FIND GROUND FAULT IN SCR HOUSE (#1TRIP TANK PUMP)
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 07 RIG UP CHAINSON BAILS TO TOP DRIVE, GREASE TOP DRIVE
11:00 - 14:00 3.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE HAD TO WASH THRU 1,207 TO 1,235 PEA GRAVEL
14:00 - 15:00 1.00 03 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 4,212 TO 4,327
15:00 - 06:00 15.00 02 DRILL FROM 4327 TO 4585 (ROP 17.2' HR) WOB 5-10, DHRPM 181, BG GAS 10,

HOLE SEEPING 2-3 BBLS HOUR
12/13/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50 02 DRILL FROM 4585 TO 4691(ROP 14.1' HR) PUMPING BIT BALLING10 BBL

SWEEPS EVERYHOUR
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 07 RIG SERVICE, TOP DRIVE, DRAW WORKS
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Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code e Description of Operations

12/17/2007 11:30 - 12:30 1.00 08 (HOSE)
12:30 - 18:30 6.00 02 DRILLFROM 5267 TO 5293 (ROP 4.3) ROP DROPPED TO 3-4' HR- HAD A

LITTLE TORQUE
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 05 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND BUILD TRIP SLUG
19:00 -23:30 4.50 06 A PUMP SLUG ANDTRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CHANGE BIT, (CHECKED FLOW-NO

FLOW,BLEW DOWNKELLY HOSE, CIRCULATE CHARGE PUMPS
23:30 - 00:00 0.50 06 J CHANGE OUT BIT AND CLEANRIG FLOOR FOR TRIP IN HOLE
00:00 - 02:00 2.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE
02:00 - 04:30 2.50 08 REPLACE BROKEN CABLE ON EASY TORQUE
04:30 -05:30 1.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 08 EASY TORQUE CABLE FELL OFF SHEIVE, PUT CABLEON SHEIVE

12/18/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 06 A TRIP IN HOLE
08:00 - 08:30 0.50 03 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 5173 TO 5293 NO FILL
08:30 - 14:00 5.50 02 BREAK BIT IN DRILL FROM 5293 TO 5360 (ROP 12.2) WOB 3-6, DHRPM

210-245, MW 9.8 VIS 43, BG GAS 9, PUT MORE WT BIT WANTSTO STICK SLIP
(TORQUE STARTS JUMPING),

14:00 - 14:30 0.50 07 SERVICE RIG--TOP DRIVE (TOOKOIL SAMPLE), SWIVEL, BLOCKS
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 08 COULDM'T GET #2 PUMP TO KlCK IN AFTER CONNECTION, TROUBLE SHOOT

OILER PUMP KICKED BREAKER-RESET BREAKER
15:00 - 06:00 15.00 02 DRILL FROM 5360 TO 5485 (ROP 8.3' HR) WORKINGALL DIFFERENT

PERAMETERS
12/19/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 02 DRILL FROM 5485 TO 5495 (ROP 5' HR)TRY ALL DIFFERNT PERAMETERS-

5-20 WOB, 30-65 ROTARY, SLOWED PUMP DOWN TO 75 STRKS, COULDN'T
GET TO DRILL (WANTINGTO STALL OUT-SLIP STICKING)

08:00 - 08:30 0.50 05 CIRCULATE AND BUILD TRIP SLUG
08:30 - 09:00 0.50 10 DROP SURVEY .2 DEG 258.6 DEG
09:00 - 13:30 4.50 06 TRIP OUT OF HOLETO CHANGEBITAND MUD MOTOR-BLEW KELLYHOSE

DOWN
13:30 - 15:30 2.00 06 J HANDLE BHA, LAY DOWN AND PICK UP NEW MOTOR, AND BIT, CLEAN

FLOOR FOR TRIP IN HOLE,TRIP TO SHOE
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 07 RIG SERVICE ANDCHANGE AIR LINESON EATON BRAKE CONTROLS (STEEL

BRAIDED)
16:00 - 19:30 3.50 06 TRIP IN HOLE FILL PIPE @BHA AND EVERY 30 STANDS
19:30 - 20:30 1.00 03 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 5,355 TO 5,495-THERE WAS 8' OF UNDER

GAGE HOLE
20:30 - 06:00 9.50 02 DRILLFROM 5 495 TO 5,550 WORKINGALLDIFFERNTPERAMETERS,

PUMPING BIT BALLINGSWEEPS, HAVE ALOT OF SLIP STICK TRY TO WORK
PERAMETERS YO RID SLIP STICK, SLIP STICKWON'T GO AWAY

12/20/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 5,550 TO 5,556 ( ROP 3' HR) WORK DIFFERNT PERAMETERS TO
GET TO DRILL ANDSTOP SLIP STICKING

08:00 - 08:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND BUILD TRIP SLUG
08:30 - 12:00 3.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO PICK UP CONE BIT
12:00 - 14:00 2.00 RIG 6 CUT & SLIP DRILL LINE
14:00 - 19:30 5.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE FILL STRING @570', 1957' & 4120' W/ NO RESISTANCE
19:30 - 20:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM F/ 5,366' TO BOTTOM @ 5,556' W/ NO PROBLEMS
20:00 - 01:30 5.50 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 5,556' TO 5,596' (40' @7.3 FPH )WOB 5/35
01:30 -02:30 1.00 OTH REMOVE LCM FROM SUCTION LINE ON #2 MUD PUMP
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 5,596' TO 5,638' ( 42' @12 FPH )WOB 32/40

12/21/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 5,638' TO 5,647' ( 9' @9' FPH )WOB 36, RPM 105
07:00 - 07:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
07:30 - 18:00 10.50 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 5,647' TO 5,735' ( 88' @8.4' FPH )WOB 30/40, RPM 90/110
18:00 - 06:00 12.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 5,735' TO 5,830' ( 95' @8' FPH )WOB 30/40, RPM 90/110 MUD WT 9.7

VIS 42, W/ NO LOSSES
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Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

12/22/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRILL FI 5,830' TO 5,837' ( 7' @4.7 FPH )WOB 35/40 RPM 90/110 MUD WT 9.7
07:30 -08:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
08:00 - 17:00 9.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 5,837' TO 5,912' ( 75' @8.3 FPH )WOB 36/40 RPM 110 MUD WT 9.7
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIR. BOTTOMSUP DROP SURVEY& PUMP PILL
18:30 - 20:30 2.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO BHA
20:30 - 03:00 6.50 ISP 1 INSPECT ALLBHA ( FOUND NO DEFECTS )
03:00 -03:30 0.50 TRP 1 CLEAN RIG FLOOR & CHANGE OUT BIT
03:30 -06:00 2.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE WI NEW 12 1/4 BIT

12/23/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE W/ NEW BIT FILL PIPE EVERY 2000' ATT. TO FILL PIPE @4120'
STRING PLUGGED

09:00 - 13:30 4.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE(WET ) DUE TO PLUGGED STRING ( FOUND TWO FEET
OF LCM IN MONELFROM FLOATVALVEUP &ATT. TO TO DRAIN MUD
MOTOR WI NO SUCCESS MOTOR WOULD NOT TURN.

13:30 - 14:00 0.50 TRP 1 LAY DOWN OLD MOTOR REPLACE WITH NEW MOTOR
14:00 - 17:30 3.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 539' CIR. 10 MINUTES-OK FILLPIPE @1766', 3258' &4501'
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 TRP 2 INSTALL ROTATE HEAD &TRIP IN HOLE TO 5,747'
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 REAM 1 WASH & REAM FI 5,747' TO 5,889' W/ NO RESISTANCE FI 5,889' TO BOTTOM

@5,912' WI2 TO 5 WOB.
19:00 - 06:00 11.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 5912' TO 6,002' ( 90' @8.2 FPH )WOB 28 TO 35, RPM 90/110, MUD WT

9.7 VIS 42
12/24/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 6,002' TO 6,026' ( 24' @ 8' FPH )WOB 32-40 RPM 105 MUD WT. 9.7 VIS

42
09:00 - 09:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE & HELD BOP DRILL
09:30 - 18:00 8.50 DRL 1 DRILL FI 6,026' TO 6,100' ( 74' @ 8.7' FPH) WOB 32/40 RPM 105 MUDWT 9.7

VIS 41
18:00 - 21:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 6,100' TO 6,120' ( 20' @6.7' FPH )WOB 35/40 RPM 105 MUD WT

9.7VIS 42
21:00 -22:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIR. BOTTOMS UP & PUMP SLUG
22:00 - 01:00 3.00 TRP 2 TOOH TO 3,129' LOST POWER TO DC MODULE TO DRILLER PANEL
01:00 -06:00 5.00 RIG 2 TROUBLE SHOOT &WAIT ON UNITS ELE.

12/25/2007 06:00 -06:00 24.00 RIG 2 WORK PIPE &WAIT ON UNITSELECTRICAN REMOVE BAD HYD. MOTOR &
WAIT ON REPLACEMENT MOTOR( MOTOR ARRIVEDON LOCATION @2130
HRS. ATT. TO INSTALL MOTOR WRONG MOTOR HOUSING )CALLED
AROUNDFOUND HYD.MOTOR INCASPER WAITINGON MOTOR COMINGF/
CASPER SHOULD BE ON LOCATION @0830 HRS.

12/26/2007 06:00 - 17:00 11.00 RIG 2 WAITINGON HYD. MOTOR REPLACEMENT - MOTOR ARRIVED@1100 HRS,
WRONG SHAFT SIZE ( FRAB. A COUPLE INSTALLEDSAME ) FRANKSHAWK
JAW TONGS ARRIVED @ 1530 HRS RIUP SAME

17:00 - 19:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 TRP 2 CHANGE OUT BIT& MOTOR
20:00 - 02:00 6.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE W/ NEW BIT & MOTOR TO 5,942'
02:00 - 03:00 1.00 REAM 1 WASH & REAMFI5,942' TO BOTTOM 6,120' W/ NO RESISTANCE
03:00 - 06:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 6,120' TO 6,143' (23 @7.7 FPH )WOB 35/40 RPM 115 MUD WT. 9.6

VIS 39 W/ NO LOSSES
12/27/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 6,143' TO 6,225' ( 82' @ 11.7' FPH )WOB 34/40 MUD WT 9.8 VIS 39

13:00 - 13:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:30 - 18:00 4.50 DRL 1 DRILLFI 6,225' TO 6,275' ( 50' @11.1' FPH )WOB 35/40 MUD WT 9.8 VIS 41
18:00 - 02:00 8.00 DRL 1 i DRILL FI 6,275' TO 6,375' ( 100' @12.5' FPH )WOB 35/40 MUDWT 9.8 VIS 40
02:00 - 02:30 0.50 CIRC 1 ICIR. BOTTOMSUP
02:30 - 05:00 2.50 TRP 15 SHORT TRIP TO 5,905' R1H TO BOTTOM @6,375'
05:00 -06:00 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP SWEEP &CIR. HOLE CLEAN

12/28/2007 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIR. &CONDITION HOLE FOR RUNNING9 5/8" CASING
08:00 - 08:30 0.50 SUR 1 DROP MULTI. SHOT & PUMP SLUG

Printed: 1/3/2008 7:59:17
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - E Hours Code e Description of Operations

12/28/2007 08:30 - 14:30 6.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
14:30 - 15:30 1.00 TRP 1 BREAKOUT BIT& LAYDOWNMOTOR &MONEL
15:30 - 16:30 1.00 OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING
16:30 -22:00 5.50 CSG 1 R/UP FRANKSCASING EQUIPMENT &STABBINGBOARD & FILL UP TOOL
22:00 - 00:30 2.50 RIG 2 ATT. TO RIG UP FLAG POLL FOR THE LAY DOWN MACHINE ROTATING

MOUSEHOLEWAS TO BIG FOR THE FLAGPOLL (WAS UNABLE TO SECURE
FLAGPOLL PROPERLY INSIDE THE R. MOUSEHOLE) LAY DOWN R.
MOUSEHOLE
GOT CASING MOUSEHOLE FROM RIG 232

00:30 -02:00 1.50 CSG 1 FINISH RIGGING UP LAY DOWN MACHINE
02:00 - 03:30 1.50 CSG 2 THREAD LOCKSHOE, &TWO JTS OF 9 5/8 CASING&FIC ATT.TO M/UP

CASING JT TONGS WAS UNABLE TO GET PROPER TORGUE ON VAM
CONNECTION

03:30 -06:00 2.50 CSG 1 RIG DOWN TONGS &WAIT ON TONGS FROM FRANKS
12/29/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CSG 2 RIG UP FRANKS 13 3/8 CASINGTONGS

07:00 - 21:00 14.00 CSG 2 RUN 9 5/8" CASING (VAM 47 # HC P 110 )SHOE, TWO JTS CASING& F/C &
TOTAL 145 JTS & LANDINGJT W/ MBS (SHOE @6,353')

21:00 - 00:30 3.50 CIRC 1 CIR. &CONDITION MUD (SHAKE OUT LCM ) R/D FRANKSCSG EQUIPMENT
00:30 - 01:30 1.00 OTH LAY DOWN FILL UP TOOL &CHANGE OUT BAILSON TOP DRIVE
01:30 - 05:00 3.50 CSG 2 P/UP 1 STD 5" HWDP FROM DERRICK M/UP PACK OFF ASSEMBLY &

RUNNINGTOOL SET PACK OFF ASSEMBLY PTT TO 5000 PSI =OK R/UP HAL
RETURN LINETO A SECTION OUTLET VALVE.

05:00 - 06:00 1.00 CSG 2 PICK UP LANDINGJT &INSTALLSAME & R/UP CMT HEAD&CMT. LINETO
RIG FLOOR & PREPARE FOR CEMENT JOB.

12/30/2007 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 CMT 2 CONT. TO P/UP LANDINGJT. & MlUP CMT TOOL & LAND SAME & R/UP CMT
HEAD AND CMT LINESTO RIG FLOOR

07:00 - 07:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
07:30 - 09:30 2.00 CMT 2 WAIT ON CAMERON PACK OFF SUPPORT BUSHING& INSTALL SAME
09:30 - 10:30 1.00 CMT 2 HOLD S/MEETINGPREPARE FOR CMT. JOB OBSERVE LOSSES
10:30 - 18:00 7.50 CIRC 2 ATT. TO CURE LOSSES PUMP LCMPILLSW/ NO SUCCESS
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 CMT 2 REPAIR HAL. FOAM DISCHARGELINE
19:00 - 00:30 5.50 CMT 2 PUMP 40 BBLSSPACER @5 BBLS/MIN. 10 BBLS FRESH WATER20 BBLS

SUPER FLUSH 10 BBLS FRESH WATER PUMP SECOND LEAD CMT. 198 BBLS
@5 BPM 14.3 PPG & DROP PLUG DISPLACE WI 466 BBLS ( PLUG DID NOT
BUMP )

00:30 -01:00 0.50 CMT 2 PUMP 55 BBLS CAP CEMENT DOWN BACK SIDE
01:00 -02:00 1.00 CMT 1 RIG DOWN CEMENTERS
02:00 - 03:30 1.50 CMT 2 PULLLANDINGJT.
03:30 - 06:00 2.50 BOP 2 P/TEST BOPS &CHOKE MANIFOLD

12/31/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 BOP 2 PITEST BOPS & CHOKE MANIFOLD LOW TEST 250PSI & HIGH TEST 5000 PSI
PTT ANN. LOW TEST 250 PSI & HIGH TEST 3500 PSI WI NO LEAKS

10:30 - 11:00 0.50 BOP 2 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
11:00 - 14:00 3.00 OTH PREPARE TO PICK UP 5" DRILL PIPE ATT. TO REMOVE PROTECTORS USING

CHAIN TONGS TO MUCH ICE HEAT PROTECTORS TO REMOVESAME CLEAN
THREADS &STRAP DRILL PIPE

14:00 - 15:30 1.50 TRP 2 RIG UP LAY TRUCK MACHINE
15:30 - 17:30 2.00 RIG 2 OBSERVE BAD HYDRAULICLEAKON DRAWWORKSFOUND HYDRAULIC

HOSE LEAKINGON DRILLERSOFF SIDE ( REPLACE SAME )
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 TRP 2 PICK UP NEW 5" S-135 DRILL PIPE M/U& B/O & M/U ALL NEW DRILL PIPE

CONN.
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 RIG 2 FIX HYDRAULICLEAK ON MlUPTONG RAM
19:00 -06:00 11.00 TRP 2 PICK UP NEW 5" S-135 DRILL PIPE M/U &BIO & M/U ALL DRILL PIPE

CONNECTIONS

Printed: 1/3/2008 7:59:17
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

1/1/2008 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE STAND 31 STDS OF S-135 DP
07:30 -08:30 1.00 TRP 1 LAYDOWN8" DRILLCOLLARS
08:30 - 10:30 2.00 OTH PREPARE TO PICK UP 6.5" DRILL COLLAR,MOTOR, IBS & DRILL PIPE
10:30 - 14:30 4.00 TRP 1 M/UP PDC &8 1/2 BHAFILL UP PIPE & BREAK CIR.
14:30 - 02:00 11.50 TRP 2 P1CK UP NEW G-105 DRILL PIPE TORQUE &BIO & RE-TORQUE
02:00 - 03:00 1.00 OTH RIG DOWN FRANKS LAY DOWN MACHINE
03:00 - 04:00 1.00 TRP 2 RUN IN HOLETO 6183'
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 WASH & REAM DN Fl 6,183' TO LANDINGCOLLAR @6,266'

1/2/2008 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 DRL 4 DRILL OUT SHOE TRACK EQUIPMENT
09:00 - 10:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 6,375' TO 6,385'
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIR. BOTTOMSUP FOR FIT
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 EQT 2 PERFORM FIT TEST TO 13.5 PPG EQUIVALENT
11:00 - 12:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 6,385' TO 6,425' (40' @27' FPH )WOB 12/14 MUD WT 9.3 VIS 39
12:30 - 13:30 1.00 REAM 1 ATT. TO REAM STAND BEFORE MAKINGMOUSEHOLE CONNECTION LAST35'

HOLEHADFELL IN (WASH & REAM BACKTO BOTTOMTHREE TIMES EVERY
TIME SAME RESULTS )CONT. TO WASH & REAM THROUGH THE 35' PUMP
SWEEP AFTER CIR SWEEP HOLE CONDITION WAS GOOD MAKE
CONNECTION

13:30 - 18:00 4.50 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 6,425' TO 6,550' ( 125' @27.8 FPH )WOB 12/15 MUD WT 9.6 VIS 42
18:00 - 06:00 12.00 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 6,550' TO 6,900' ( 350' @ 29.2 FPH )WOB 12/18 MUD WT 9.5 VIS 40 W/

NO LOSSES &NO HOLE PROBLEMS
1/3/2008 06:00 - 17:00 11.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 6900 TO 7366 (ROP 42.3' HR) WOB 10-14, DHRPM 98, MW 9.5, BG

GAS 5, HOLESEEPING 5 -10 BBL.S HR PUMPING 12% LCMSWEEPS
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @7305 1.3 DEG 147.2 AZ
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG ANDTOP DRIVE
18:00 - 06:00 12.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 7366 TO 7795 (ROP 35.7' HR) WOB 10-14, OHRPM 100, MW 9.4,

BG GAS 5, HOLESEEPING 10 BBL.S HR.

Printed: 1/3/2008 7:59:17



orm 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED

(November 199‡) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR xp re
0301

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0558
Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
N/A
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side RED WASH UNIT
1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8 Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator RW 34-34AD
QUESTAR EXPLORATION &PRODUCTION, CO. 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36351
11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078 435-781-4331 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M, or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED
858' FSL 1944' FEL SI/VSESECTION 34, T7S, R22E 11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-OfT

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice
[¯]

Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide lhe Bond No on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
Following cornpletion of the involved operations If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
Testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afler all requirements, including reclamation, have been completect and the operator has
determined that the si1e is ready for final inspection.)

DUE TO THE MANCOS SHALE FORMATION BEING SHALLOWER THAN ANTICIPATED. QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY(QEP) SET 7" CASING AT 12,675. THE APPROVED SETTING DEPTH WAS 13,000'.
A CEMENT BOND LOG WILL BE RAN AND SUBMITTED TO YOUR OFFICE IN THE NEAR FURTURE.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoingis true and correct
Name (Printed/ d) Title

Jan Nels n Regulatory Affairs
Signature Date

January 21, 2008
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE USE

Approve Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval ofthis notice does not warrant or certify OffÏce
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subjectlease which would
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any depar1ment or agency ofthe United States any false, fictitious or

fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse)



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
WV 4D-12-8-21

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth
Uinta Surface
Green River 3,025'
Wasatch 6,425'
Mesaverde 9,325'
Sego 11,775'
Castlegate 11,925'
Blackhawk 12,253'
Mancos Shale 12,709'
Mancos B 13,133'
Frontier 15,839'
Dakota Silt 16,731'
Dakota 16,933'
TD 17,500'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas. Or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 6,425'
Gas Mesaverde 9,325'
Gas Blackhawk 12,253'
Gas Mancos Shale 12,709'
Gas Mancos B 13,133'
Gas Dakota 16,933'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
WV 4D-12-8-21

DRILLING PROGRAM

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected, samples will
be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be
obtained from Wonsits Valley water right # A36125 (which was filed on May 7, 1964,) or
Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined
by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before1989 is not
depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to supply fresh water for drilling purposes.
All water resulting from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash Central
Battery Disposal Site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site;
SWNW, Section 12, T8S, R21E.

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 13-5/8" 2000 psi annular BOP (schematic included) from surface casing seat to 9-5/8"
casing point.

B. 11" or 13-5/8" 10,000 psi double gate, 10,000 psi single gate, 10,000 psi annular
BOP (schematic included) from 9-5/8" casing point to total depth. The choice of BOP
stacks is based on the drilling contractor's availability.

C. Functional test daily

D. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psi/foot or 1500 psi, whichever is
greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed the
internal yield pressure of the casing.

E. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure of
casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 10M system and individual components shall
be operable as



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
WV 4D-12-8-21

DRILLING PROGRAM

4. Casing Design:

Hole Csg. Top Bottom Wt. Grade Thread Cond.
Size Size (MD) (MD)

26" 20" sfc 40-60' Steel Cond. None Used
17-1/2" 13-3/8 sfc 500' 54.5 K-55 STC New

12-1/4" 9-5/8" sfc 6300' 47 HCP-110 Flush New
Jnt **

8-1/2" 7" sfc 9,000' 26 HCP-110 LTC New
SDrift

8-1/2" 7" 9000' 12,750' 29* HCP-110 LTC New
SDrift

6-1/8" 4-1/2" sfc 13,000' 15.1 P-110 LTC New

6-1/8" 4-1/2" 13,000' 15,000' 15.1 Q-125 LTC New

6-1/8" 4-1/2" 15,000' 17,500' 17.1 Q-125 LTC New

Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile
(minimum)

13-3/8" 54.5 lb. K-55 STC 1,130 psi 2,730 psi 547,000 lb.

9-5/8" 47 lb. HCP-110 LTC 7,100 psi 9,440 psi 1,213,000 lb.

7" 29 lb.* HCP-110 LTC 9,200 psi l1,220 psi 797,000 lb.

4-1/2" 15.1 lb. P-110 LTC 14,350 14,420 psi 406,000 lb.
psi***

4-1/2" 15.1 lb. Q-125 LTC 15,840 16,380 psi 438,000 lb.
psi***

4-1/2" 17.1 lb. Q-125 LTC 19,010 psi 18,180 psi 493,000 lb.
* Special Drift
** Flush Jnt - VAM SLIJ II or LT&C based on availability
MINIMUM DESIGN FACTORS:

COLLAPSE: 1.125-1.3***
BURST: 1.10
TENSION:
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QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
WV 4D-12-8-21

DRILLING PROGRAM

Area Fracture Gradient: 0.9 psi/foot
Maximum anticipated mud weight: 15.4 ppg
Maximum surface treating pressure: 12,500 psi

5. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - yes

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually and/or PVT/Flow Show

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Rotating Head - yes
If drilling with air the following will be used:

1. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

2. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling
below 500').

3. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

4. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

Surface hole and the first intermediate hole section (12-1/4" hole) will be drilled with air,
air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions. Drilling below the first intermediate
casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily of fresh water,
bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will be used. It is
intended to use oil base mud in the production hole. Maximum anticipated mud weight is
15.4 ppg. The high mud density is required more for hole stability and not necessarily
pore pressure.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to
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DRILLING PROGRAM

6. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores - none anticipated

B. DST - none anticipated

C. Logging - Mud logging - 4500' to TD
GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density, FMI

D. Formation and Completion Interval: Mancos interval, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation - Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

7. Cementing Program

20" Conductor:
Cement to surface with construction cement.

13-3/8" Surface Casing: sfc -- 500' (MD)
Slurry: 0' - 500'. 610 sxs (731 cu ft) Premium cement + 0.25 lbs/sk Flocele + 2% CaCl2
Slurry wt: 15.6 ppg, slurry yield: 1.20 ft3/sx, slurry volume: 17-1/2" hole + 100% excess.

9-5/8" Intermediate Casing: sfc --5,900' (MD)
Lead Slurry: 0' - 5,500'. 1582 sks (2325 cu. ft) Foamed Lead 50/50 Poz cement + 0.1
% FDP-C766-05 (Low Fluid Loss Control) + 5 #/sx Silicate Compacted + 20 % SSA-1 +

0.1 % Versaset + 1.5 % Zonesealant 2000 (Foamer) Slurry wt: 14.3 ppg, (unfoamed) or
11.0 ppg. (foamed) Slurry yield: 1.47 ft3/sk (unfoamed), Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 35
% excess.
Tail Slurry: 5,500' - 5,900'. 57 sks (15 bbls) Tail 50/50 Poz cement + 0.1 % FDP-
C766-05 (Low Fluid Loss Control) + 5 #/sx Silicate Compacted + 20 % SSA-1 + 0.1 %
Versaset Slurry wt: 14.3 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.47 ft3/sk, Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 35%
excess.

7" Intermediate Casing: sfc - 12,750' (MD)
Foamed Lead Slurry 2: sfc - 12,750'. 1271 sks (2021 cu ft) 50/50 Poz Premium + 20%
SSA-1 + 3 % silicalite compacted + 3% Silicalite Compacted + 0.5% Halad 344 + 0.2%
Halad 413 + 0.1% HR-12 + 0.7% Super CBL + 0.2% Suspend Slurry wt: 14.0 ppg,,
Slurry yield: 1.59 ft3/sk, Slurry volume: 8-1/2" hole + 25%
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DRILLING PROGRAM

4-1/2" Production Casing: sfc - 17,500' (MD)
Lead/Tail Slurry: 6,500 - 17,500'. 939 sks (1399 cu ft) Premium Cement + 17.5% SSA-
1, + 4% Microbond HT, + 0.2% Halad 344 + 0.5% Halad 413, + 0.3% CFR-3, + 0.9%
HR-12, + 0.2% Super CBL, + 0.2% Suspend HT, 17.5% SSA-2. Slurry wt: 16.2 ppg,
Slurry yield: 1.49 ft3/sk, Slurry volume: 6-1/8" hole + 35% in open hole section.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface on the intermediate string and 6,500' on the production
string. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and across zones as required by
the authorized officer to insure protection of natural resources.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No H2S has been encountered in or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar
depths in the general area. Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals
approximately 10,000 psi to l 1,000 psi based on pressure transient work on the GB 9D-
27-8-21. Maximum anticipated bottom hole temperature is 300°

-

310° F.

9. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR OIL BASE MUD:

A. See attached diagram of well pad layout. A reserve pit will be constructed for this
location. This pit will be constructed so that a minimum of two vertical feet of
freeboard exists above the top of the pit at all times and at least one-half of the
holding capacity will be below ground level. The pit will be lined with a synthetic
reinforced liner, 30 millimeters thick, with sufficient bedding used to cover any rocks
prior to putting any fluids into the pit. The pad will be designed so that runoff from
adjacent slopes does not flow into the reserve pit. The liner will overlap the pit walls
and be covered with dirt and/or rocks to hold it in place. At the beginning of drilling
operations this reserve pit will have an open-ended dike placed in the pit that allows
the fluids to migrate from one side of the pit to the other during the drilling of the
surface and intermediate hole using water based mud. At the time that operations
begin to drill the production hole with oil base mud, this dike will be extended,
dividing the pit into two distinct, isolated halves allowing no migration of fluids from
one side to the other. At that time all fluids will be removed from the end of the pit to
be used as a cuttings pit. This cuttings pit will be used for oil based cuttings
generated during drilling of the production
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B. Oil-base mud will be mixed in the closed circulating system and transferred to four
500-bbl tanks on location for storage prior to and after drilling operations. Drip pans
will be installed below the rotary beams on the substructure and can be viewed on site
from the cellar area. As the production section of the hole is drilled, the cuttings
transported to the surface with the drilling fluid will be mechanically separated from
the drilling fluid as waste by two shale-shakers and then cleaned/dried via a mud
cleaner and/or centrifuge. These separated cuttings will be collected in a steel catch
tank once they leave the closed circulating system and transported and placed into the
cuttings half of the reserve pit.

C. Plastic material will underlay the rig, oil base mud/diesel storage tanks and mud pits.
All tanks on location will be placed inside of berms. Any oily waste fluids and
sediments generated at the work site during drilling operations or when cleaning the
fluid containment system after drilling will also be placed into the cuttings half of the
pit.

D. All rig ditches will be lined and directed to a lined sump for fluid recovery. A drip
pan will be installed on the BOP stack, a mud bucket will be utilized as needed on
connections and a vacuum system will be used on the rig floor for fluid recovery in
those areas.

E. Once all waste has been placed in the cuttings portion of the pit and all necessary
approvals obtained, the oilfield waste management consultant Soli-Bond or a similar
company will mobilize equipment and personnel to the site to perform the cement
based solidification/stabilization process in-situ for encapsulation. Soil will be
backfilled over the processed material used on the cuttings side of the pit and that
portion of the pit area will be returned to the existing grade bordering the pit. Please
see the attached Soli-Bond Proposal for Processing and Disposal of Drilling Waste
for specific details. The half of the reserve pit containing water base materials will be
left to evaporate and will be closed and reclaimed at the time that portion of the pit is



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
WV 4D-12-8-21

DRILLING PROGRAM
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
WV 4D-12-8-21

DRILLING PROGRAM
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Sec 12-T8S-R21E
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Drilling Fluids Program

410 1/ Street, Suite 460 Denver, CO 80202
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† Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460 - Denver, Colorado 80202 - (303) 623-2205 - FAX (720) 904-7970

January 18, 2008

Mr. Jim Davidson
Chief Drilling Engineer
QuestarExploration & Production
1331 17th Street, Suite 800
Denver, Colorado 80202

RE: WV 4D-12-8-21
Sec 12-T8S-R21E
Uintah Co, Utah

Mr. Davidson:

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP is pleased to present the enclosed revised recommended drilling fluids program for the
WV 4D-12-8-21 well to be drilled in Uintah County, Utah. This program is for drilling with Aerated Saltwater in the 1st in-
termediate to 5900 ft, a polymer fluid system in the 2nd intermediate interval to 12,750 ft, then to T.D. at 17,500 ft with
OBM.

The Surface Interval will be pre-set at a depth of 500 ft.

For the 1st intermediate Interval, an aerated saltwater drilling fluid is planned.

Brine kill pills may be needed for trips, logs, and casing operations, depending on pressure encountered while drilling.
Trona water flows in this area may require a mud weight of 9.5-9.8 ppg to control.
Mud weight at interval T.D. at 5,900 is expected to be in the 8.8-9.0 ppg range.

In the 2nd intermediate interval, drill out with fresh water or mud-up before drilling out, as hole conditions dictate. When a
mud-up is needed, mud-up to a NewPHPA/Polymer system.
Mud weight in this interval is expected to be in the 11.2-11.4 ppg range at the 13,000 ft liner interval T.D.

In the Production interval, displace to a 12.0-12.5 ppg OptiDrill OBM system. Maintain fluid density as low as possible to
increase penetration rates and reduce the possibility of lost circulation. Use high weight pills for well control during; trips,
logs, and casing operations. Mud weight at T.D. is expected to be at +/-15.5 ppg.

The projected drilling time for this project is 65-70 days with an estimated material and engineering cost of $500,000.00as-
suming no unusual delays or problems are encountered. The estimate is based on minimal losses and a 15.0 ppg mud weight
at TD. Costs will increase dramatically if severe losses are encountered.

All sack material and bulk barite will be furnished from our Grand Junction, Colorado facility, with OBM supplied from
Newpark's Boulder, WY facility.
If you have any questions following your review of this proposal, please call.

Regards,

Estes Ward
Operations Manager
Newpark Drilling Fluids,



Project Summary o'j"Thr"
Se c 12-TBS-R21E

Uin ah, County Utah

Depth Formations interval Comments Mud Mud Properties
(it) Weight

(ppg)

Hole size: 17 1/2"/ Casing: 13 3/8" NA NA
Uinta

AIR DRILLED
500' Surface T.D.

Aerated Salt Water 9.5-10.0 Vis (sec/qt): Water
Hole size: 11.0"/ Casing: 9 5/8" Flush Joint

PV (cp): NA
Drill out with saltwater aerating as needed to maintain

3,025' Green River circulation. When water is encountered reduce air as
Mahogeny needed to control the flow. YP (#s/100ft2):NA

Pump pre-hydrated NewGel or Flowzan ISaltGelsweeps for
increased hole cleaning and for any tight hole and/or FL (ml/30 min): NC
torque.
For trips, spot heavy brine if needed for trona flow, and at
intermediate T.D. check hole conditions and spot high LGS %: < 1%
viscosity mud if needed.
If hole conditions dictate a mud-up, base the system on pH: 10.5-10.8
the chloride content of the fluid.

1st
Intermediate Mud weight required at T.D. is expected to be in the 8.8- CI (mg/l): 150-200K

9.0 ppg range
5,900' T.D.

9.5-10.0

6,425' Wasatch NewPHPA/Polymer 8.8 Vis (sec/qt): 40-45
9,325' Mesa Verde Hole size: 8.5 "/ Liner: "I"

Mud up as hole conditions dictate to a NewPHPA/ PV (cp) : 12-20
Polymer system. Maintain properties as outlined in-
creasing the PHPA concentration to 1 ppb. 10.0

YP (#s/100ft2): 10-12
10,500 Sego Lost circulation may be a problem in this interval. If lost
11,775' Bucktongue circulation is encountered, pump LCMpills as needed.

FL ml/30 : 6-8
If LCMpills will not control losses, by-pass the shakers ( rmn)

and increase the LCMconcentration in the system as
11,925' Castlegate needed. LGS %: 3-5
12,253' Blackhawk if severe lost circulation is encountered, consider a 11.0
12,709' Mancos Shale DynaPlug squeeze- pH: 10.0-10.5

2nd Hole instability may be encountered in the Mesa Verde.
Monitor torque, pump pressure, connection fill,and trip

12,750'+/ Intermediate conditions for indications of hole instability and con- Cl (mg/l): 11-15K

T.D. sider adding Asphalt if hole conditions dictate. 11.2
PHPA: 1.0 ppb

OptiDrill OBM PV (cp): 15-25
Hole size: 6-1/8"/ Casing: 4-1/2"

13,133' Mancos B Drill out with the OptiDrill system, treating cement 11.2 YP (Ibs/100ft2): 8-10

contamination as needed with OptiWet to prevent
shaker blinding. HPHT (mis/30 min.):<20
Maintain hole cleaning during high ROP's with high
viscosity sweeps. Use a 1:1 ratio of OptiVis RM and O/W : 80:20 - 85:15

15,839' Frontier equiv· he gas stream while drilling under balanced will
16,731' Dakota Silt require additional Lime, emulsifiers and wetting agent. ES: 500+
16,933' Dakota

Maintain mud weight as needed for well control.
Spot high weight ECD pills for trips, logs, and cas- Lime: 2-4 ppb
ing 15.5

17,500' Total Depth operations. LGS %: < 6

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



s

Project Su mmary Explo i n P 2dlucNon

Sec 12-TBS-R21E
Uintah, County Utah

DRILLINGFLUID PROPERTIES
Surface Hole: Air Drilled

Hole TVD Mud Plastic Yield API Total
Size (ft) Weight VISCOSity Point Fluid Loss Solids
(in) (ppg) (cp) (Ib/100ft2) (ml/30min) (%)

17 1/2 " 0-500' NA NA NA NA NA

1st Intermediate Hole: Aerated Saltwater
Hole MD Mud PlaStic Yield API Chloride LGS
Size (ft) Weight Viscosity Point Fluid LOSS Mgli Solids
(in) (ppg) (cp) (Ibl100ft2) (mil30min) (xiooo) (%)

11" 500'-5,900' 9.5-10.0 NA NA NA 150-200 < 1%

2nd Intermediate Interval: NewPHPA/Polymer
Hole MD Mud PlaStic Yield API pH LGS
Size (it) Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss Solids
(in) (ppg) (cp) (Ib/100ft2) (mil30min) "°'

8 1/2" 5,900'-8,000' 8.5-8.8 6-12 6-10 8-10 10.0-11.0 < 1%

8 1/2 " 8,000'-12,750' 11.2-11.4 12-18 12-15 6-8 10,0-11.0 3-6

Production Interval: OptiDri/I OBM
Hole MD Mud Plastic Yield O/W HPHT CaCL Electrical LGS
Size (ft) Weight VIScosity Point Ratio Fluid LOSS (mg/l) Stability Solids
(in) (ppg) (cp) (Ib/100ft2) (%) (mil30min) lo ooo

(mv) (%)

6-1/8 " 12,750'-17,500' 15.0-15.5 20-30 8-10 85/15 12-15 250-350 500 + 3-6

• Drillingfluid properties are guidelines only.
• Mud weights for guidelines only, allow hole conditions to dictate actual mud weights.
• Hole conditions should be closely monitored and product mix adjusted accordingly.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Questar
ist Intermediate Interval Exploradon & ProducHon

WV4D-12-8-21
11" Hole (500'- 5,900') Sec 12-TOS-R21E

Uintah, County Utah

ist Intermediate Interval Drilling Fluid Properties
Depth Mud Viscosity Plastic Yield pH API Hardness Low Chlorides

Interval Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss Gravity Mg/I
(TVD) (ppg) (sec/qt) (cp) (Ib/100ft2) (mil30min) Mg/l) Solids (x1000)

500'-5,900'+/- 9.5-10.0 NA NA NA 8.0-10.0 NA NA <1.0 150-200

• Drill out with Saltwater maintaining chlorides as needed for fluid weight. Aerate the fluid as needed to maintain circula-

tion.
• If a water flow is encountered, balance air and fluid weight as needed to maintain circulation
• Pump pre-hydrated NewGel and/or Flowzan/SaltGel sweeps for increased hole cleaning, along with LCM sweeps for

seepage (Paper LCM while drilling with water)
• If water flows are encountered, spot heavy brine pills for trips, logs and casing operations.
• If hole conditions dictate a mud-up, system used will depend on chloride concentration of the fluid.
• Offset information indicates the 1st major loss zone to be at +/- 3600 ft.
• Shallow easloverpressurewas encountered on some offsets in the area at 3,700-4,000'. A 9.5-9.9 ppe fluid was needed to

control pressure.

Challenges: Strategies:
Ifencountered, pump sweeps of pre-hydrated NewGel with a viscos-

Gravel/Unconsolidated formation ity of 150 -300 sec/qt.

Ifwater flows become excessive, control hydrostatic as needed withWater Flows (Trona) air additions and fluid density.

Lost Circulation While drillingwith water, pump LCMsweeps consisting of paper.
11drillingwith mud, pump mixed LCMpills in the 20-30% LCM range.

Pump sweeps on a regular basis and for any indications of insuffi-
Hole Cleaning cient hole cleaning. Circulate and pump sweeps before connections

and for any anticipated down time.

Increase ROP with PDC Bits Pump 20-40 bbl. Sweeps with NewEase 203, New100N, DynaDet,
and SAPP. (FlexDrill Sweeps)

Hole Instability/Sloughing Shale Consider a mud-up and Asphalt additions.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



1st Intermediate Interval ExploradOue t rroduc#on

11" Hole (500'- 5,900') WV4D-12-8-21
Sec 12-TBS-R21E

Uintah, County Utah

Offset Data:
• Wells in this area have encountered major losses at +/- 3600 ft.
• Gravellunconsolidated formation has been encountered at 1380 ft.
• Gasloverpressure has been encountered at 3,700'-4,000'.

Fluid Recommendations:
• Drill out cement, float collar and new formation. Test the integrity of the casing seat and squeeze if necessary.
• Drill out with Saltwater, aerating as needed to maintain circulation.
• Ifwater is encountered, control flow with reduced air and fluid density.
• If a Trona Water flow is encountered additions of Lime and/or Calcium Chloride should be used to adjust alka-

linities as needed.
• The use of a premix tank is highly recommended. Pre-Hydrate NewGel for use as sweeps and for viscosity

when a mud up is needed. Fill premix tank with fresh water. Treat out hardness with SodaAsh as needed.
Add 0.25-0.5 ppb Caustic Soda for a 10.0-10.5 pH. Begin additionsof 20-25 ppb NewGel allowsufficientcir-
culating time for maximum hydration. Add 1.0-2.0 ppb CFL II. Then mix additional NewGel (30-40 ppb total)or
a 120+ funnel viscosity. The pre-hydrated bentonite can be pumped from the premix to the pill tank and
pumped downhole for sweeps or can be added slowly to the Saltwater for viscosity and rheology control.

• If penetration rates slow sweeps with New 100N, NewEase 203, SAPP, and DynaDet should be considered.
(1% New 100N, 1% NewEase 203, 0.5-0.75 ppb SAPP, 0.2% DynaDet). "Flex Sweeps"

• For trips, an increase in mud weight may be necessary to killwater flows. 9.8-10.0 ppg brine should be consid-
ered for this operation.

• Seepage and/or lost circulation may become a problem. For seepage while drilling with water, pump 20-30 bbl
pills containing Paper LCM.

• If losses become severe, consider a mud up and LCM sweeps of Cedar Fiber and FiberSeal should be
pumped and incorporated into the system as needed. If losses continue, increase coarse LCM in active system
to 15-20%. If losses continuethe use of a DynaPlug Squeeze is stronglyrecommended.

• At TD increase funnel viscosity for logs and casing operations as hole conditionsdictate. Suggest funnel vis-
cosity be increased to 45-50 sec/qt, before logging operations be attempted.

• At 5,900' ( intermediate T.D.) short trip, check hole conditions. If hole conditions dictate, add pre-hydrated New-
Gel from the premix tank to the active system to increase funnel viscosity to 45-50 sec/qt and spot in the open
hole for logs and casing operations

DRILL STRING PACK-OFF: Rapid penetration rate during fast drillingoften deteriorates to pack-off, a situation which can
lead to lost circulation and/or stuck pipe. Pack-off is typicallyself-induced by exceeding the maximum rate of penetration
for a given annularflow rate. The solutionto this is to control the penetration rate to a level that the pumps can adequately
clean the hole while maintaining rheological properties in line with existing hydraulic parameters.

SOLIDS CONTROL: It is of the utmost importance that the shale shakers and flow line cleaners be equipped with the fin-
est screens possible, and yet handle the flow rate. The desander and desilter units should be evaluated periodically and
serviced to maximize performance.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



2nd Intermediate Interval Explorat¡
næ&Parroduction

8 1/2" Hole (5,900'- 12,750') WV4D-12-8-21
Sec 12-TBS-R21E

Uintah, County Utah

2nd Intermediate Interval Drilling Fluid Properties
Depth Mud Viscosity Plastic Yield pH API Hardness Low

Interval Weight Viscosity Point Fluid Loss Gravity
(TVD) (ppg) (sec/qt) (cp) (Ibl100ft2) (ml/30min) Mg/l) Solids

5,900'-8,000' 8.6-8.8 32-36 6-12 6-10 10.0-11.0 8-10 100+ 4-6

8,000'-12,750' 11.2-11.4 45-50 10-18 12-14 10.0-11.0 6-8 100+ 4-6

• Drill out with water and or mud as hole conditions dictate. After mud-up , allow the system to revert to a fresh water poly-
mer system.

• As mud weight is increased, seepage losses can become severe. Treat with LCM pills as needed. If pill treatments will not
contain the losses at reasonable levels, by-pass the shakers, retaining the pills and allowing the LCM concentration to in-
crease as needed.

• Hole instability can occur in the Mesa Verde in this area. If encountered, consider adding Asphalt, building to a 4-6 ppb
concentration.

• High pressure may be encountered in the Castlegate/Blackhawk. Monitor closely for increased pressure while drilling and
use caution on trips to minimize possible swabbing.

• Mud weight at Liner Interval T.D. is expected to be in the 11.2-11.4 ppg range.

Challenges: Strategies:
Hole Instability/Sloughing Shale Consider 4-6 ppb Asphalt

. Monitor well conditionsand increase density as neededIncrease in Formation pressure with NewBar as needed.

As mud weight is increased (10.0ppg +) seepage and
losses may become a problem. For seepage pump 50
bbl sweeps with 5-10 ppb DynaFiber and 10-20 ppb
NewCarb as needed. For partial or total losses pump
sweeps with 10-15 ppb FiberSeal and Cedar Fiber.Seepage/Lost Circulation Severity of losses willdetermine size and quantity of
LCMadded. If losses are not controlled with sweeps
consider 10-15% LCMin active system. For severe
losses the use of a DynaPlug squeeze should be con-
sidered.

Maintain mud weight as low as possible. Control Low
Differential Sticking Gravity Solids below 6%, and control fluid loss at 8-10

mls/30 min.

Pump 20-40 bbl. Sweeps with NewEase 203, Newi00N,Increase ROP with PDC Bits DynaDet, and SAPP. (FlexDrill Sweeps)

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



2nd Intermediate Interval Exporati
nue rroduction

8 1/2" Hole (5,900'-12,750') WV4D-12-8-21
Sec 12-TBS-R27E

Uintah, County Utah

Offset Data:
Wells in this area have experienced losses as mud weights are increased to controlformation pressure. LCMsweeps are
strongly recommended for this reason. Mud weights should be keep as low as practical but increases to 11.2 ppg may be
required by LinerTD at 12,750'.

• Loss zones on offset wells were at 9200 ft and 9500 ft.

Fluid Recommendations:

• Drillout cement, float collar and new formation with the system from the previous interval. Test the integrity of
the casing seat and squeeze if necessary.

• Drillout with water and or mud. Ifdrilling out with water consider a mud up by +/- 7500 ft or as hole conditions
dictate.

• Begin additionsof 0.5-1.0 ppb NewPHPA and maintain throughoutthe interval.
• Maintain viscosity with PreHydrated NewGel until chlorides have dropped below 5000-7000 mg/l. After chlo-

rides have dropped NewGel will not need to be pre-hydrated and can be added directly to the system.
• Begin additionsof NewPHPA. Concentration of NewPHPA should be maintained at 0.5-1.0 ppb throughoutthe

interval. As mud weight increases additions of PHPA should be switched from NewPHPA DLMW to the shorter
chain NewPHPA DSL.

• If hole conditions dictate, consider 4-6 ppb Asphalt.
• If penetration rates slow sweeps with New 100N, NewEase 203, SAPP, and DynaDet should be considered.

(1% New 100N, 1% NewEase 203, 0.5-0.75 ppb SAPP, 0.2% DynaDet). "Flex Sweeps"
• Increase mud weight as needed to control formation pressures as needed. Mud weights should be maintained

as low as practical to reduce chance of losses and differential sticking. Increase mud weight as needed with
NewBar.

• As density increases additionsof NewEdge and/or DrillThin should be added for rheology control.
• As bottom hole temperatures increase and additionalfluid loss controlis desired supplement the NewPACwith

DynaPlex for fluid loss control Lower API filtrate to 6-8 cc's with additions of NewPAC and DynaPlex.
• As mud weight is increased seepage and/or lost circulationmay become a problem. For seepage pump 20-30

bbl pills containing a combination of NewCarb and DynaFiber mixed at a 2:1 ratio. If partial or total returns are
encountered, LCM sweeps with a varied size distribution including Cedar Fiber and Fiber Seal, PhenoSeal
and other assorted sizes should be considered and incorporated into the system as needed. 20-25% LCM in
the active system may be required. The type, size and quantity of LCM used will depend on the severity of
losses. If losses are severe a DynaPlug squeeze should be considered.

• At TD increase funnel viscosity for logs and casing operations as hole conditions dictate. Suggest funnel vis-
cosity be increased to 50-55 sec/qt, before logging or casing operations be attempted.

• While circulatingcasing it is recommended to reduce Yield Points for cementingoperations.

Newpark Drilling FluicIs, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Production Interval Explora#
nue rroduction

6 1/8" Hole (12,750'-17,500') «v4D-12-s-21
Sec 12-TBS-R21E

Uintah, County Utah

Production Interval Drilling Fluid Properties
Depth Mud Plastic Yield O/W HTHP Excess Electrical Low CaCI

Interval Weight Viscosity Point Ratio Fluid Loss Lime Stability Gravity Mg/1
(TVD) (ppg) (cp) (Ib/100ft2) % (ml/30min) (PPB) (MV) Solids Water

12,750'-17,725' 15.0-15.5 25-35 8-10 85:15 12-15 2-4 500+ < 6 300K

Drilling Fluid Recommendations: (12,750'-17,500')
• Displace to a OptiDrill OBM after finishing the liner job at 12,750'.
• After displacement, maintain the OptiDrill system within the parameters outlined above.
• Offsets in the area have encountered high rates of seepage in this interval. If indications of seepage are observed,

sweeps of NewCarb C, Dynafiber C & M, NewSeal, and CyberSeal are recommended. Mixing ratios are recom-
mended to be at 5:1 NewCarb M to DynaFiber , NewSeal, and CyberSeal. If losses continue to be a problem, con-
sider trying different sizes and combinations until ssepage is slowed.

• Maintain rheology low to reduce ECD values and reduce surge and swab during connections and trips.
• Drill as underbalanced as possible to help prevent losses and increase penetration rates.
• For pressure control, spot high weight pills with an equivalent mud weight to drilling ECD's. On trips in, stage these

pills out and divert to storage for further use. High weight pills in excess of the drilling ECD should be avoided due to
possible lost circulation.

Challenges Strategies

Displacement • Have 1200-1300 bbls of OBM volume on location along with a pump capable of keeping up
with displacement rates.

• Pump a 10-20 bbl viscosified OBM spacer ahead of the OpyiDrill (enough for 500 ft + sepa-

ration)
• A steady pump rate for either turbulent or plug flow should be used. Reciprocate and rotate

to assist in minimizing channeling.
• Do not shut down once displacement commences.
• Should any contamination occur, isolate the contaminated fluid for reconditioning.

Seepagellost Circulation. Pump LCM sweeps when seepage and/or losses are indicated. Sweeps should be a mixture of ,

NewCarb, DynaFiber, NewSeal, and CyberSeal. If lost returns are encountered, consider a Di-
aseal M or cross linked polymer squeeze.

Maintaining Oil wet solids For every 1.0 ppg mud weight increase, mix 0.02 gallbbl OptiWet

Pressure control • Spot weighted pills calculated to give a bottom hole pressure equal to drilling ECD.
• Do not exceed drilling bottom hole pressure with the ECD pill. Lost circulation has been a

problem on offset wells.
• Stage weighted pills out of the hole and recover for future use.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Production Interval °"*""'
Exploration & Production

,, Hole (12,750'-17,500') WV4D-12-8-21
Sec 12-TBS-R21E

Uintah, County Utah

Maintenance Procedure:

HPHT - Maintain HPHT values within programmed parameters. Additions of OptiMul and OptiPlus, at recommended
concentrations should maintain the HTHP at recommended levels. If hole conditions indicate a need for lower HPHT
values, Opti G at 2-4 ppb is recommended.

Electrical Stability- Electrical stability should be used as a guide not as an absolute in determining maintenance require-

ments. Actual values are not critical but should be observed for trends or changes. Decreases in electrical stability
should be noted along with other mud properties to determine treatments. To increase electrical stability add emulsifi-
ers and wetting agents OptiMul and OptiPlus or decrease water content.

Oil/Water Ratio - Maintain the oillwater ratio in the 90:10-80:20 range depending on mud weight and condition.. Higher
water content will decrease the amount of OptiVis needed for rheology.

Mud weight - Maintain minimum fluid densities with solids equipment. Monitor hole conditions and all drilling parame-
ters closely for indications of increases in formation pressures and adjust fluid densities accordingly. Drilling with a
minimum amount of overbalance will reduce the possibility of losing returns and/or of differentially sticking the drill
string. Mud weight on offset wells was in the 15.0-15.5 ppg range at T.D.

Rheology - Maintain solids as low as possible. Increase rheology as needed for hole cleaning with a combination of
OptiVis (Bentone 910) and Opti Vis RM or Opti Vis PS and water content.

Lime - Maintain the excess Lime at 2-3 ppb excess.

Hole cleaning - Calculate rheology requirements based on ROP, pump rates and hole conditions. Adjust as needed .

Mud losses downhole-Monitor ECD's with Hy-Calc, maintaining the lowest values possible. If losses are encountered;
sweeps containing NewCarb, DynaFiber, Opti-G, and NewSeal should be circulated to aid in the prevention of
losses. If seepage losses continue and/or become severe, consider spotting a pill with Magma Fiber (Fine & Regu-
lar) and the above formulation. Keep the hole full at all times, and avoid excessive swabbing and/or surge actions
when tripping.

Solids Control - Maintain low gravity solids at 4-6 % by volume. The high performance shakers should be equipped with
the finest mesh screens that will handle the circulating volume and not cut barite out.

Water Contamination- Keep all water sources off the mud pits. If contamination occurs, treat with emulsifiers and Cal-
cium Chloride as needed.

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



Production Interval ouesta,
Exploration & Production

6 1/8" Hole (12,750'-17,500') WV4D-12-8-21
Sec 12-T8S-R21E

Uintah, County Utah

Recommended materials for relaxed filtrate OptiDrill system :

( 85:15 Oil/Water Ratio)

Product Function Concentration

NewBar Weighting material As needed

OptiVis Organophilic Clay / Viscosifier 2-4 ppb

OptiMul Primary Emulsifier 2.0 ppb

OptiPlus Secondary Emulsifier 4.0 gallbbl.

OptiVis RM Low End Rheology Modifier 0.1-0.2 ppb

Calcium Chloride Water Internal Phase 10.0%-20.0 % by volume

Calcium Chloride Salinity/Activity 300,000 - 350,000 mg/I

OptiG Fluid Loss control Additive 1.0-4.0 ppb

Lime Alkalinity Additive 5 ppb

NewCarb M Loss Circulation Material 10.0 ppb

NewCarb F Loss Circulation Material As required

DynaFiber Loss Circulation Material As required

Newpark Drilling Fluids, LP
410 17th Street, Suite 460
Denver, CO. 80202
(303) 623-2205 FAX (720) 904-7970 Page



WV 7BD-23-8-21

20" Conductor CSA 40-60'

AIR Drilled

3-3/8" 54.5# K-55 CSA 500'

Green River @2,563'

Salt Water System
Wasatch @5,883' Aerated to reduce losses and promote ROP

9-5/8" 47# HCP-110 LT&C CSA 6000'

Mesaverde @8,843'

Mud: Polymer System
Sego @11,303'

Castlegate @11,423'

Blackhawk @11,767'

Mancos Shale @12,202' 7" 29# special Drift for 6-1/8" and 26#
HCP-110 CSA 12,300' +I- (case off at least the Mancos Top)

Mancos "B" @12,618'

Mud - OBM

Frontier @15,265'

Dakota Silt @16,181'

Dakota @16,458'
4-1/2" 15.1 # P-110 & Q-125
17.1# Q-125CSA



Form3160-5 . UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0135

(November 1998) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires July 31, 1996

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0558
Do not use this form for proposals to driH or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

abandoned weß. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
N/A
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side RED WASH UNIT
1. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well
[¯

] Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator RW 34-34AD
Questar Exploration &Productíon Co. Contact: Jan Ne/SOn 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-36351
11002 East 17500 South Vernal, Utah 84078 |435-781-4331 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

3 UNDESIGNATED
858' FSL 1944' FEL, SWSE, SECTION 34, T7S, R22E 11. Countyor Parish, State

UINTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

O Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon CASING CHANGE
Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomple1e horizontally, give subsurface locations and measared and true vertical depths of aR pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be perf<rmed or provide lhe Bond Na on file with BLMIBIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
Following completion of 1he involved operations If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Fcrm 3160-4 shan be filed once
Testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only af1er all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
deiermined that the si1e is ready for fmal inspection.)

Questar Exploration & Production Company is requesting permission to change the grade and weight of the4-1/2" casing to
enhance the resistance to collapse.

Please see revised 8 point Drilling Plan attached.
Accepted by the
Utah DMalon of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY
RECEIVED

AIItechnicalquestions can be addressed to Jim Davidson, Drilling Engineer, at (303) 308-3090. FEBO4 2008
DIXOF011.GW nilFING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title

LauraeBil RegeulatoryA20 8s

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or cerdfy Office
that the applicant holds legalor equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would
entitle the applicant to conductoperationsthereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor agency of the United States any false, fictitious or

fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse)



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QuestarExploration & Production Company
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth
Uinta Surface
Green River 3,276'
Wasatch 6,526'
Mesaverde 9,276'
Sego 11,601'
Castlegate 11,756'
Blackhawk 12,111'
Mancos Shale 12,570'
Mancos B 12,985'
Frontier 15,866'
Dakota Silt 16,778'
Dakota 16,988'
Morrison 17,478'
TD 17,725'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas. Or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 6,526'
Gas Mesaverde 9,276'
Gas Blackhawk 12,11l'
Gas Mancos Shale 12,570'
Gas Mancos B 12,985'
Gas Dakota



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QuestarExploration & Production Company
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected, samples will
be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be
obtained from Wonsits Valley water right # A36125 (which was filed on May 7, 1964,) or
Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined
by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right number filed before1989 is not
depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to supply fresh water for drilling purposes.
All water resulting from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash Central
Battery Disposal Site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site;
SWNW, Section 12, TSS, R21E.

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 13-5/8" 5000 psi double gate, 5,000 psi annular BOP (schematic included) from
surface hole to 7" casing point. A 13-5/8" 10,000 psi double and single gate may be
substituted based on contractor availability and substructure height of the drilling rig.

B. 11" or 13-5/8" 10,000 psi double gate, 10,000 psi single gate, 10,000 psi annular
BOP (schematic included) from 7" casing point to total depth. The choice of BOP
stacks is based on the drilling contractor's availability.

C. Functional test daily

D. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psilfoot or 1500 psi, whichever is
greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed the
internal yield pressure of the casing.

E. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 50 percent of internal yield pressure of
casing whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum
requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing
requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 10M system and individual components shall
be operable as



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QuestarExploration & Production Company
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

4. Casing Design:

Hole Csg. Top Bottom Wt. Grade Thread Cond.
Size Size (MD) (MD)

26" 20" sfc 40-60' Steel Cond. None Used
17-1/2" 13-3/8 sfc 500' 54.5 K-55 STC New

12-1/4" 9-5/8" sfc 8500' 47 HCP-110 SLIJ New
II*

8-1/2" 7" sfc 9000' 26 HCP-110 LTC New

8-1/2" 7" 9000' 13,000' 29* HCP-110 LTC New
SDrift

6-1/8" 4-1/2" sfc 13,000' 15.1 P-110 LTC New

6-1/8" 4-1/2" 13,000' 15,000' 15.1 Q-125 LTC New

6-1/8" 4-1/2" 15,000' 17,475' 17.1 Q-125 LTC New
* Flush Joint

Casing Strengths: Collapse Burst Tensile
(minimum)

13-3/8" 54.5 lb. K-55 STC 1,130 psi 2,730 psi 547,000 lb.

9-5/8" 47 lb. HCP-110 LTC 7,100 psi 9,440 psi 1,213,000 lb.

7" 26 HCP-110 LTC 7,800 psi 9,950 psi 693,000 lb.

7" 29 lb.* HCP-110 LTC 9,200 psi 11,220 psi 797,000 lb.

4-1/2" 15.1 lb. P-110 LTC 14,350 14,420 psi 406,000 lb.
psi***

4-1/2" 15.1 lb. Q-125 LTC 15,840 16,380 psi 438,000 lb.
psi***

4-1/2" 17.1 lb. Q-125 LTC 19,010 18,130 psi 493,000 lb.
psi***

* Special



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QuestarExploration & Production Company
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

MINIMUM DESIGN FACTORS:

COLLAPSE: 1.0 -
1.3***

BURST: 1.10
TENSION: 1.80

Area Fracture Gradient: 0.9 psi/foot
Maximum anticipated mud weight: 15.4ppg
Maximum surface treating pressure: 12,500 psi

5. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock -- yes

B. Float at the bit - yes

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually and/or PVT/Flow Show

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Rotating Head - yes
If drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling
below 500').

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will
be used. It is not intended to use oil in the mud, however, in the event it is used, oil
concentration will be less than 4% by volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 15.4
ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QuestarExploration & Production Company
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

6. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores - none anticipated

B. DST - none anticipated

C. Logging - Mud logging - 4500' to TD
GR-SP-Induction, Neutron Density, FMI

D. Formation and Completion Interval: Mancos interval, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation -- Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as
encountered.

7. Cementing Program

20" Conductor:
Cement to surface with construction cement.

13-3/8" Surface Casing: sfc - 500' (MD)
Slurry: 0' - 500'. 610 sxs (731 cu ft) Premium cement + 0.25 lbs/sk Flocele + 2% CaCl2
Slurry wt: 15.6 ppg, slurry yield: 1.20 ft3/sx, slurry volume: 17-1/2" hole + 100% excess.

9-5/8" Intermediate Casing: sfc - 6300' (MD)
Lead Slurry: 0' - 5,900. 1697 sks (444 bbls) Foamed Lead 50/50 Poz cement + 0.1 %
FDP-C766-05 (Low Fluid Loss Control) + 5 #/sx Silicate Compacted + 20 % SSA-1 +

0.1 % Versaset + 1.5 % Zonesealant 2000 (Foamer) Slurry wt: 14.3 ppg, (unfoamed) or
11.0 ppg. (foamed) Slurry yield: 1.47 ft3/sk(unfoamed), Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 35
% excess.
Tail Slurry: 5,900' - 6,300'. 115 sks (30 bbls) Tail 50/50 Poz cement + 0.1 % FDP-
C766-05 (Low Fluid Loss Control) + 5 #/sx Silicate Compacted + 20 % SSA-1 + 0.1 %
Versaset Slurry wt: 14.3 ppg, Slurry yield: 1.47 ft*/sk, Slurry volume: 12-1/4" hole + 35%
excess.

7" Intermediate Casing: sfc - 13,000' (MD)
Foamed Lead Slurry 2: 5,500' - 13,000'. 748 sks (1189 cu ft) 50/50 Poz Premium +

20% SSA-1 + 3 % silicalite compacted + 3% Silicalite Compacted + 0.5% Halad 344 +

0.2% Halad 413 + 0.1% HR-12 + 0.7% Super CBL + 0.2% Suspend Slurry wt: 14.0 ppg,,
Slurry yield: 1.59 ft3/sk, Slurry volume: 8-1/2" hole + 25%



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QuestarExploration & Production Company
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

4-1/2" Production Casing: sfc - 17,725' (MD)
Lead/Tail Slurry: 6,700 - 17,725'. 941 sks (1402 cu ft) Premium Cement + 17.5% SSA-
1, + 4% Microbond HT, + 0.2% Halad 344 + 0.5% Halad 413, + 0.3% CFR-3, + 0.9%
HR-12, + 0.2% Super CBL, + 0.2% Suspend HT, 17.5% SSA-2. Slurry wt: 16.2 ppg,
Slurry yield: 1.49 ft*/sk, Slurry volume: 6-1/8" hole + 35% in open hole section.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface on the intermediate string and 5,000' on the production
string. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and across zones as required by
the authorized officer to insure protection of natural resources.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately I 1,000 psi based on P*
pressure data from wells completed in the Dakota. Maximum anticipated bottom hole
temperature is 305° F. A mud weight of 15 ppg is anticipated to be required based on hole



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QuestarExploration & Production Company
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

BOP Requirements:

13-5/8" Rotating Head

13-5/8" 5M Spacer Spool

13-5/8" 10MAnnular

13-5/8" 10M Double Ram

13-5/8" 10MMud Cross

2" KillLine 3" Choke Line

13-5/8" 10M Single Ram

G.L GL
Mat Board Mat Board

13-5/8" SM x 13-5/8" 10M Multi-Bowl
"B" Sect

13-5/8" 5M "A" Section

QEP / Wexpro

13-3/8" 54.5# KSS Casing
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QuestarExploration & Production Company
RW 34-34AD

DRILLING PROGRAM

Reclamation for Oil Base Cuttings

Prior to drilling out the 7" casing with oil base mud, the reserve pit will be separated at
the dike with an additional liner to form 2 separate reserve pits. (Please review the
attached survey plat).

Cuttings in the production hole (6-1/8" hole section) will be drilled with oil base mud.
During the drilling operations, the cuttings will be collected and held in a steel 500 bbl
collection tank on the drilling site. After the rig has completed drilling operations, the
collected cuttings will be mixed and encapsulated with Solibond or an equivalent process
in one of the reserve pits. The encapsulated cuttings will be left on site in the reclaimed
reserve pit. The other reserve pit will dry out from water base cuttings and this pit will be
reclaimed as well using conventional methods. Please review the attached Solibond
process and



Questar E & P ON.0OLÑO Page 1 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: RW 34-34AD
Common Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 3/12/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

3/12/2008 08:00 - 17:00 9.00 LOG 2 C-LOG MIRULONEWOLF ELU. MUAND RIHWITHCCLIGRICBL/VDL
LOGGINGTOOLS. TAG PBTD AT 17,178'. STARTED LOGGING AND
TOOLS QUIT. POOH ANDREPLACE TOOLS. GBIHWITHNEW
TOOLS. TAG PBTD. PULL300' STRIP TO CORRELATE TO HES OH
LOG DATED 1/17/08. LOG FROM PBTD TO 7,800' WITH0 PSI. EST.
TOC AT 8,300'. BHT 305*. POOH ANDRDMOELU.

3/18/2008 15:00 - 17:00 2.00 EQT 1 C-PRE MIRUIPS PUMP TRUCK AND TEST 4 1/2" CSG TO 10,000 PSI. HELD
GOOD BLEED TO ZERO. RU ON THE 4 1/2"X7"ANNULUSAND
TEST TO 3,000 PSI. HELDGOOD BLEED TO ZERO. RDMOIPS
PUMP TRUCK.

3/20/2008 08:00 - 13:00 5.00 PERF 2 C-PERF MIRUOWP ELU. PERF STG #1 WITH8- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120*

PHASE, 11 GRAM CHARGE. SHOOT 42 HOLES FROM 17,033' TO
17,184'.

13:00 - 16:30 3.50 STIM 3 C-STIM RU HES AND FRAC STAGE #1 WITH800 GAL. 15% HCLAT 10 BPM,
883 BBLS40# HYBOR-GCARRYING26,000 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITE
SAND.SCREENED OUT WITH 2 PPA ON FORMATION.11,000 LBS
PROP PLACED IN FORMATIONAND 15,000 LBS LEFT INTHE PIPE.
AVGRATE=44 BPM. AVG PSI= 10,158.

16:30 - 19:00 2.50 PTST 2 C-STIM FLOW BACK270 BBLS TO CLEANUP. THEN LOADEDCSG WITH
250 BBLS SLICKWATER.5.8 BPM AT 9,600 PSI.

19:00 -22:00 3.00 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #2 WITH 7- 2' GUN LOADED3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAM CHARGE. SET 3.44" CFP AT 16,950 WITH 6,800 PSI. SHOOT
42 HOLES FROM 16,350' TO 16,913'.

22:00 - 06:00 8.00 STIM 3 C-STIM SDFN
3/21/2008 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #2 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCLAT 10 BPM, 1,073 BBLS

10# LINEAR GEL CARRYING12,900 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITE
SAND.SCREENED OUT WITH 0.75 PPA ON FORMATION. 8,100 LBS
PROP PLACED IN FORMATIONAND 4,700 LBS LEFT INTHE PIPE.
AVGRATE=30.6 BPM. AVG PSI= 10,994.

07:30 - 09:30 2.00 PTST 2 C-STIM FLOW BACK 250 BBLSTO CLEANUP. THEN LOADEDCSG WITH
250 BBLSSLICKWATER.10.0 BPM AT 10,350 PSI.

09:30 - 12:30 3.00 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #3 WITH7- 2' GUN LOADED3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAMCHARGE. SET 3.44" CBP AT 16,270' WITH 7,900 PSI. SHOOT
42 HOLES FROM 15,701' TO 16,233'.

12:30 - 13:30 1.00 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #3 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,405 BBLS
LINEARGEL CARRYING17,600 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITE SAND. AVG
RATE= 33.2 BPM. AVGPSI= 11,213.

13:30 - 17:30 4.00 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #4 WITH 7- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAMCHARGE. SET 3.44" CBP AT 15,620' WITH 8,000 PSI. SHOOT
42 HOLES FROM 15,000' TO 15,592'.

17:30 - 19:30 2.00 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #4 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCLAT 10 BPM, 1,919 BBLS
LINEAR GEL CARRYlNG8,120 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITESAND. AVG
RATE= 18 BPM. AVG PSI= 11,522.

19:30 - 22:30 3.00 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #5 WITH 7- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAMCHARGE. SET 3.44" CFP AT 14,940' WITH8,000 PSI. SHOOT
42 HOLES FROM 14,348' TO 14905'.

3/22/2008 06:00 - 07:00 1.00 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #5 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,881 BBLS
10# LINEAR GEL CARRYlNG23,300 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITE SAND.
AVGRATE= 38 BPM. AVG PSI= 10,553

07:00 - 09:30 2.50 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #6 WITH 7- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAMCHARGE. SET 3.44" CBP AT 14,247' WITH 6,800 PSI. SHOOT
42 HOLES FROM 13,662' TO 14,236',

09:30 - 11:00 1.50 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #6 WITH800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,454 BBLS

Printed: 4/1/2008 8:59:25 AM



Questar E & P Page 2 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: RW 34-34AD
Common Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 3/12/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

3/22/2008 09:30 - 11:00 1.50 STIM 3 C-STIM LINEAR GEL CARRYING13,100 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITE SAND. AVG
RATE=26.4 BPM. AVG PSI= 10,951.

11:00 - 13:00 2.00 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #7 WITH 7- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAM CHARGE. SET 3.44" CBP AT 13,578' WITH 6.800 PSI. SHOOT
42 HOLES FROM 13,007' TO 13,554'.

13:00 - 14:30 1.50 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #7 WITH800 GAL. 15% HCLAT 10 BPM, 1,932 BBLS
LINEAR GEL CARRYlNG60,400 LBS#20/40 SB-EXCEL SAND. AVG
RATE=42.0 BPM. AVG PSI= 9,792.

14:30 - 16:20 1.83 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #8 WITH 8- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAM CHARGE. SET 3.44" CFP AT 12,910' WITH 5,200 PSI. SHOOT
48 HOLES FROM 12,268' TO 12,881'.

16:20 - 17:10 0.83 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #8 WITH800 GAL. 15% HCLAT 10 BPM, 1,893 BBLS
LINEAR GEL CARRYING60,300 LBS#20/40 SB-EXCEL SAND. AVG
RATE= 43.4 BPM. AVGPSI= 9,839.

17:10 - 19:00 1.83 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #9 WITH7- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAMCHARGE. SET 3.44" CFP AT 11,650' WITH 5,000 PSI. SHOOT
42 HOLES FROM 11,366' TO 11,617'.

19:00 -20:00 1.00 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #9 WITH800 GAL. 15% HCLAT 10 BPM, 2,249 BBLS
LINEAR GEL CARRYING76,400 LBS#20/40 SB-EXCEL SAND. AVG
RATE= 47.3 BPM. AVG PSI= 9,335.

3/23/2008 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 STIM 3 C-STIM SD FOR EASTER.

3/24/2008 06:00 - 08:15 2.25 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #10 WITH8- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAM CHARGE. SET 3.44" CFP AT 10,860' WITH 2,900 PSI. SHOOT
48 HOLES FROM 10,715' TO 10,847'.

08:15 - 09:30 1.25 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #10 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 902 BBLS
LINEAR GEL CARRYING20,400 LBS#20/40 CRC SAND INTO
FORMATION. LEFT 8,000 LBS PPA INWELLBORE. AVGRATE= 46.0
BPM. AVG PSI= 9,218. CUT SAND EARLY,SCREENED OUT IN 1.75
LBS PPA SAND.

08:15 - 12:15 4.00 PTST 2 C-OTH FLOWED WELL BACK TO CLEAN UP WELLBORE. PUMPED FLUSH
VOLUME DOWN CSG. CONTINUE ON WITH COMPLETION.

12:15 - 13:15 1.00 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #11 WITH8-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAM CHARGE. SET 3.44" CBP AT 10,410' WITH 3,000 PSI. SHOOT
48 HOLES FROM 10,014' TO 10,386'.

13:15 - 14:45 1.50 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #11 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCLAT 10 BPM, 2,668 BBLS
LINEAR GEL CARRYING99,160 LBS#20/40 CRC SAND. AVG RATE=
49.9 BPM. AVG PSI= 6,585.

14:45 - 16:15 1.50 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #12 WITH 8- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAM CHARGE. SET 3.44" CFP AT 9,670' WITH2,000 PSI. SHOOT
42 HOLES FROM 9,319' TO 9,640'.

16:15 - 17:00 0.75 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #12 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,364 BBLS
LINEAR GEL CARRYING40,645 LBS#20/40 CRC SAND. AVG RATE=
40.5 BPM. AVG PSl= 6,912.

17:00 - 18:00 1.00 PERF 2 C-PERF PERF STG #13 WITH 7-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAM CHARGE. SET 3.44" CFP AT 8,070' WITH 1,800 PSI. SHOOT
18 HOLES FROM 8,026' TO 8,032'.

18:00 -20:30 2.50 STIM 3 C-STIM FRAC STAGE #13 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCLAT 10 BPM, 694 BBLS
DELTA GEL CARRYING49,450 LBS#20/40 CRC SAND. AVG RATE=
31.0 BPM. AVG PSI= 5,242. RDMO HES ANDOWP ELU.

3/25/2008 06:00 - 23:30 17.50 DRL 6 C-ST1M MIRU IPS CTU, LOAD CT WITH 120* F WATER. MU EXPRESS 2 7/8'
MOTOR/JARSWITH3.625" 5-BLADEJUNK MILL. TEST STACKTO

i
Printed: 4/1/2008 8:59:25



Questar E & P Page 3 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Legal Well Name: RW 34-34AD
Common Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Event Name: COMPLETION Start: 3/12/2008 End:
Contractor Name: Rig Release: Group:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Phase Description of Operations

3/25/2008 06:00 -23:30 17.50 DRL 6 C-STIM 8,000 PSI. RIH AND DRILL OUT 12 PLUGS IN 10 HOURS. TAG PBTD
AT 17,212'. PUMP FINAL 10 BBLSSWEEP AND POOH. FLOWINGTO
SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT. RDMOIPS CTU.

3/26/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 6 C-STIM FLOWINGTO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT.
3/27/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 6 C-STIM FLOWINGTO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT.
3/28/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 6 C-STIM FLOWINGTO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT.
3/29/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 6 C-STIM FLOWINGTO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT.
3/30/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 6 C-STIM FLOWINGTO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT. RDMO FBE.

TURN OVER TO PRODUCTION.
3/31/2008 06:00 - 06:00 24.00 DRL 6 C-STIM FLOWINGTO SALES THROUGH PRODUCTION. ND 4 1/16" FRAC

HEAD,SENT TO CAMERONFOR INSPECTION.

Printed: 4/1/2008 8:59:25



Forn 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0558

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a differentreservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposalS 5. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

N/A

SUBMITINTRIPLICATE COPYSN \UUPchAlub 7.IfUnitorCA,AgreementDesignation

1. Type of Well RED WASH UNIT

Well Well Other a S 8. Well Name and No.

RW 34-34AD
2. NameofOperator

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY 9. API We11No.

3.
Address and Telephone No. Contact: Mike Stahl 43-047-36351

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 Phone: (303) 308-3613 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED

858' FSL 1944' FEL, SWSE, SECTION 34, T7S, R22E 11. CountyorParish,State

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, )R OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

Other Commingling Dispose Water

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent « etails, and give pertinent dates, includingestimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionallydrilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)
"In compliance with the stated objectives of the Federal Regulations for Onshore Oil & Gas Operations and the applicable Federal Unit Agreement, Questar
Exploration and Production Company hereby requests the commingling of production between intervals in the RW 34-34AD. Questar considers this
commingling to be in the public interest in that it promotes maximum ultimate economic recovery, prevents waste, provides for orderly and efficient
production of oil and gas and presents no detrimental effects from commingling the two gas streams.

Questar requests approval for the commingling of production between the Dakota and Wasatch formations. Based upon offset production logs, the proposed
initial allocation is as follows: Dakota - 20%, Mancos - 40%, Mesa Verde - 30%, Wasatch - 10%.

A production log will be run within 30 days to determine contribution from each interval. At that time a Subsequent Report will be filed detailing the results
of the production log.

On an annual basis the gas will be sampled and a determination will be made of the BTU content and gas constituents. These annual samples can be used to
determine if the gas allocation is changing over time. If these samples do not indicate that any adjustments in allocation are necessary they may be
discontinued after the fifth anniversary of the initial production.

14. I hereby certify that the f egoing is true and correct
Signed Title Associate Regulatory Affairs Analyst oat 03/31/2008

(This space for Federal or State office use)

odt

sbo

approval, if any

Title SSR

se, fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsorTitle 18 U.S.C.Section1001, makes it a crime for ly and willfully to make to any dep e o
representations as to any matter within its jurisdicti ED oate.

APRO2 2008 *s=Ng•",R + CONFIDENTIAL
DIVOFOIL,GAS&



Form 31604 Form approved.
(November 1983) UNITED STATES SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE Budget Bureau No. 1004-0137

(lormerly9-330) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR (See other in- ExpiresAugust 31, 1985
BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT structions on

Verseside). 5, LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
UTU-0558

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG * N/A

la. TYPE OF WELL OIL GAS 7. UNITAGREEMENTNAME
WELL WELL DRY Other RED WASH UNIT

b TYPE OF COMPLETION

NEW WORK DEEP- PLUG DIFF. 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
WELL OVER EN BACK RESVR Other N/A

2 NAME OF OPERATOR 9. WELL NO.
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. RW 34-34AD

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. Contact: Dahn Caldwell 435-781-4342 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH - VERNAL, UT 84078 Fax # 435.781.4357

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly andin accordance with any State requiremens)" REDWASH

At surface 858' FSL, 1944' FEL, SWSE, SEC 34-T7S-R22E II. SEC.,T., R., M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY
OR AREA

At top rod. interval reported below 858' FSL, 1944' FEL, SWSE, SEC 34-T7S-R22E SEC 34-T7S-R22E

At total depth 858' FSL, 1944' FEL, SWSE, SEC 34-T7S-R22E

\14. PERMITNO. DATEISSUED 12. COUNTYOR 13. STATE
PARISH

43-047-36351 UINTAH UT
15 DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL (Readyto prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (Dl RKB, RT, GR, ETC.)* 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

6/7/07 11/02/07 3/25/08 . 'B
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG BACK T.D.,MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLECOMPL, 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANY* DRILLED BY
17,227' 17,212' -----> X

24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETiON-TOP, BOTIOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADE

SEE ATTACHMENT ONE
NO

26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED
CCLIGR/CBL/VDL, ARRAY COMP TRUE RESISTIVITY, SPECTRAL DENSITY DSN S( S NO

28. CASING RECORD (Report aß strines set in weñ)
CASING SIZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNTPULLED

13-3/8" 54.5# 502' 17-1/2" 500 SXS
9-5/8" 47# 6353' 12-1/2" 1540 SXS

7" 26# & 29# 12646' 8-1/2" 475 SXS
4-1/2" 15.1# & 16.28# 17214' 6-1/8" 700 SXS

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBINGRECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

N/A N/A NIA N/A
31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interud, size andnumber) 32. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE,ETC.
SEE ATTACHMENT ONE DEPTH INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

SEE ATTACHMENT ONE SEE ATTACHMENT ONE

33? PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gas hft, pumpingeize and type ofpump) WELL STATUS(Producing or

shut-in)
3/25/08 FLOWING PRODUCING

DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N FOR OIL-BBL. GAS-MCF. WATER-BBL GAS-OILRATIO
TEST PERIOD

3/28/08 24 28 ----> 30 1600 1950
FLOW. TUBING PRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL-BBL GAS-MCF WATER-BBL OIL GRAVITY-API(CORR.)

24-HOUR RATE
N/A 1600

34. DISPOSITTONOF GAS (Sold, usedfor fuel vented, etc.) TEST WITNESSED BY
SOLD

35. LISTOFATTACHMENT3
PERFORATION DETAIL ATTACHMENT ONE

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attach forngtion is plete and corect as dete vailable records

SIGNED JIM SIMONTON LE COMPLETION SUPERVISOR DATE 6/3/08

(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side)

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any departmentor 44¾CENEUnited States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
.IUNO5 2008

DNOFOIL,GASA



37. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES: (Show all importantzones of porosity and contentsthereof; cored intervals; and alldrill-stemtests, includingdepth intervaltested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures,and 38. GEOLOGIC MARKERSrecoveries):
RW 34-34AD

FORMATION TOP BOTTOM DESCRIPTION, CONTENTS, ETC. TOPWASATCH 6557' NAME MEAS. DEPTH TRUEMESA VERDE 9252'
VERT. DEPTHCASTLEGATE 11747' WASATCH 6557'BLACKHAWK 12109' MESA VERDE 9252'MANCOS 12525' CASTLEGATE 11747'MANCOS 'B' 12994' BLACKHAWK 12109'FRONTIER 15900' MANCOS 12525'DAKOTA SILT 16811' MANCOS 'B' 12994'DAKOTA 17027' FRONTIER 15900'TD 17227' DAKOTA SILT 16811'

DAKOTA 17027'
TD



RW 34-34AD - ATTACHMENTONE
PERFORATION DETAIL:
Open Perfs Stimulation

8026'-8032' Frac w/ 49,450 Lbs in 29,148 Gals Open- Wasatch

9319' - 9321' Open - Mesa Verde
9553' - 9557' Open - Mesa Verde
9614'-9618' Frac w/ 40,645 Lbs in 57,288 Gals Open - Mesa Verde
9636' - 9640' Open - Mesa Verde

10014'-10016' Open - LMV
10186' - 10188' Open - LMV
10198'-10200' Open - LMV
10224'-10226' Open - LMV
10299'- 10301' Frac w/ 99,160 Lbs in 112,056 Gals Open - LMV
10362'-10364' Open - LMV
10373'-10375' Open - LMV
10384' - 10386' Open - LMV

10715'-10719' Open - LMV
10764' - 10768' Frac w/ 20,400 Lbs in 37,884 Gals Open - LMV
10801'-10805' Open - LMV
10843'- 10847' Open - LMV

11366'-11368' Open - LMV
11373' - 11375' Open - LMV
11445'- 11447' Open - LMV
11456'- 11458' Frac w/ 76,400 U)s in 94,458 Gals 0pen- LMV
11538' - 11540' Open - LMV
11599'-11601' Open - LMV
11615' - 11617' Open - LMV

12268' - 12272' Open - Mancos 'B'
12341' - 12343' Open - Mancos 'B'
12410'- 12412' Open - Mancos
12508'-12510' Frac w/ 60,300 Lbs in 79,506 Gals 0pen- Mancos
12672'- 12674' Òpen- Mancos
12803' - 12805' Open - Mancos
12879'- 12881' Open - Mancos

13007'- 13009' Open - Mancos 'B'
13070' - 13072' Open - Mancos 'B'
A3188'-13190' Open - Mancos
13298'- 11300' Frac w/ 60,400 Lbs in 81,1+‡ Gals Open - Mancos
13390' - 13392' Open - Mancos
13493'- 13495' Òpen- Mancos
13552'- 13554' Open -



13662'- 13664' Open - Mancos
13760'-13762' Open - Mancos
13857'- 13859' Open - Mancos
13963'- 13965' Frac w/ 13,100 Lbs in 61,068 Gals Open - Mancos
1 32' - 14034' Open - Mancos
14138'- 14140' Open - Mancos
14234'-14236' Open - Mancos

14348' - 14350' Open - Mancos
14411'-14413' Open - Mancos
14515'- 14517' Open - Mancos
14588'-14590' Frac w/ 23,300 Lbs in 79,002 Gals Open - Mancos
14660'- 14662' Open - Mancos
14783'- 14785' Open - Mancos
14903'-14905' Open - Mancos

15000' - 15002' Open - Mancos
15104'-15106' Open - Mancos
15233'- 15235' Open - Mancos
15317'- 15319' Frac w/ 8,120 Lbs in i 80,598 Gals Open - Mancos
15401' - 15403' Open - Mancos
15510'- 15512' Open - Mancos
15590'-15592' Open - Mancos

15701'- 15703' Open - Mancos
15776'-15778' Open- Mancos
15906'- 15908' Open - Frontier
15984'- 15986' Frac w/ 17,600 Lbs in 59,010 Gals Open - Frontier
16063'-16065' Open - Frontier
16155'- 16157' Open - Frontier
16231' - 16233' Open - Frontier

16350'- 16352' Open - Frontier
16426'- 16428' Open - Frontier
16544' - 16546' Open - Frontier
16641'- 16643' Frac w/ 12,900 Lbs in 45,066 Gals Open - Frontier
16745'- 16747' Scnd Out Open - Frontier
16821'- 16823' Open - Dakota Silt
16911' - 16913' Open - Dakota Silt

17033'-17035' Open - Dakota
17059'- 17061' Open - Dakota
17131'- 17133' Frac w/ 26,000 Lbs in 37,086 Gals Open - Dakota
17159'- 17165' Scnd Out Open - Dakota
17180'- 17184' Open -



Questar E & P Oo pk¾oYN Page 1 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007

Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name:

' Rig Number:

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

3/12/2008 08:00 -17:00 9.00 LOG 2 MIRU LONE WOLF ELU. MU AND RIH WITH CCL/GR/CBL/VDL LOGGING
TOOLS. TAG PBTD AT 17,178'. STARTED LOGGING AND TOOLS QUIT. POOH
AND REPLACE TOOLS. GBlH WITH NEW TOOLS. TAG PBTD. PULL 300' STRIP
TO CORRELATE TO HES OH LOG DATED1/17/08. LOG FROM PBTD TO 7,800'
WITH O PSL EST. TOC AT 8,300'. BHT 305*. POOH AND RDMO ELU.

3/18/2008 15:00 -17:00 2.00 EQT 1 MIRU IPS PUMP TRUCK AND TEST 4 1/2" CSG TO 10,000 PSL HELD GOOD
BLEED TO ZERO. RUONTHE4 1/2"X7"ANNULUS AND TEST TO 3,000 PSI.
HELD GOOD BLEED TO ZERO. RDMO IPS PUMP TRUCK.

3/20/2008 08:00 - 13:00 5.00 PERF 2 MIRU OWP ELU. PERF STG #1 WITH 8- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11
GRAM CHARGE. SHOOT 42 HOLES FROM 17,033' TO 17,184',

13:00 -16:30 3.50 STIM 3 RU HES AND FRAC STAGE #1 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 883 BBLS
40# HYBOR-G CARRYlNG 26,000 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITE SAND.SCREENED
OUT WITH 2 PPA ON FORMATION.11,000 LBS PROP PLACED IN FORMATION
AND15,000 LBS LEFT IN THE PIPE. AVG RATE= 44 BPM. AVG PSI= 10,158.

16:30 - 19:00 2.50 PTST 2 FLOW BACK 270 BBLS TO CLEAN UP. THEN LOADED CSG WITH 250 BBLS
SLICKWATER. 5.8 BPM AT9,600 PSI.

19:00 -22:00 3.00 PERF 2 PERF STG #2 WITH 7-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM CHARGE.
SET 3.44" CFP AT 16,950 WITH 6,800 PSI, SHOOT 42 HOLES FROM 16,350' TO
16,913'.

22:00-06:00 8.00 STIM 3 SDFN
3/21/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 ST1M 3 FRAC STAGE #2 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,073 BBLS 10# LINEAR

GEL CARRYlNG 12,900 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITE SAND.SCREENED OUT WITH
0.75 PPA ON FORMATION.8,100 LBS PROP PLACED IN FORMATION AND 4,700
LBS LEFT INTHE PIPE. AVG RATE= 30.6 BPM. AVG PSl= 10,994.

07:30 -09:30 2.00 PTST 2 FLOW BACK 250 BBLS TO CLEAN UP. THEN LOADED CSG WITH 250 BBLS
SLICKWATER. 10.0 BPM AT 10,350 PSI.

09:30 - 12:30 3.00 PERF 2 PERF STG #3 WITH 7-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM CHARGE.
SET 3.44" CBP AT 16,270' WITH 7,900 PSI. SHOOT 42 HOLES FROM 15,701' TO
16,233'.

12:30 -13:30 1.00 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #3 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,405 BBLS LINEAR GEL
CARRYlNG 17,600 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITE SAND. AVG RATE= 33.2 BPM. AVG
PSI= 11,213.

13:30 -17:30 4.00 PERF 2 PERF STG #4 WITH 7-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM CHARGE.
SET 3.44" CBP AT 15,620' WITH 8,000 PSL SHOOT 42 HOLES FROM 15,000' TO
15,592'.

17:30 - 19:30 2.00 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #4 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,919 BBLS LINEAR GEL
CARRYING8,120 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITESAND. AVG RATE=18 BPM.AVG
PSI= 11,522.

19:30 -22:30 3.00 PERF 2 PERF STG #5 WITH 7-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM CHARGE.
SET 3.44" CFP AT 14,940' WITH 8,000 PSL SHOOT 42 HOLES FROM 14,348' TO
14905'.

3/22/2008 06:00 -07:00 1.00 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #5 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,881 BBLS 10# LINEAR
GEL CARRYlNG 23,300 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITE SAND. AVG RATE= 38 BPM.
AVG PSt= 10,553

07:00 -09:30 2.50 PERF 2 PERF STG #6 WITH 7-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM CHARGE.
SET 3.44" CBP AT 14,24T WITH 6,800 PSI. SHOOT 42 HOLES FROM 13,662' TO
14,236'.

09:30 -11:00 1.50 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #6 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,454 BBLS LINEAR GEL
CARRYlNG 13,100 LBS#20/40 SINTERLITE SAND. AVG RATE= 26.4 BPM. AVG
PSl= 10,951.

11:00 -13:00 2.00 PERF 2 PERF STG #7 WITH 7-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM CHARGE.
SET 3.44" CBP AT 13,578' WITH 6.800 PSI. SHOOT 42 HOLES FROM 13,007 TO
13,554'.

Printed: 6/3/2008 1:49:29



Questar E & P Page 2 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

3/22/2008 13:00 -14:30 1.50 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #7 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,932 BBLS LINEAR GEL
CARRYING 60,400 LBS#20/40 SB-EXCEL SAND. AVG RATE= 42.0 BPM. AVG
PSI= 9,792.

14:30 -16:20 1.83 PERF 2 PERF STG #8 WITH 8- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM CHARGE.
SET 3.44" CFP AT 12,910' WITH 5,200 PSI. SHOOT 48 HOLES FROM 12,268' TO
12,881'.

16:20 -17:10 0.83 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #8 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,893 BBLS LINEAR GEL
CARRYING 60,300 LBS#20/40 SB-EXCEL SAND. AVG RATE= 43.4 BPM. AVG
PSl= 9,839.

17:10 -19:00 1.83 PERF 2 PERF STG #9 WITH 7- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM CHARGE.
SET 3.44" CFP AT 11,650' WITH5,000 PSI. SHOOT42 HOLES FROM11,366' TO
11,61T.

19:00 - 20:00 1.00 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #9 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 2,249 BBLS LINEAR GEL
CARRYING 76,400 LBS#20/40 SB-EXCEL SAND. AVG RATE= 47.3 BPM. AVG
PSI= 9.335.

3/23/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 STIM 3 SD FOR EASTER.

3/24/2008 06:00 -08:15 2.25 PERF 2 PERF STG#10 WITH 8-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM
CHARGE. SET 3.44" CFP AT 10,860' WITH 2,900 PSI. SHOOT 48 HOLES FROM
10,715' TO 10,84T.

08:15 -09:30 1.25 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #10 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 902 BBLS LINEAR GEL
CARRYING 20,400 LBS#20/40 CRC SAND INTOFORMATION. LEFT8,000 LBS
PPA IN WELL BORE. AVG RATE= 46.0 BPM. AVG PSI= 9,218. CUT SAND EARLY,
SCREENED OUT IN 1.75 LBS PPA SAND.

08:15-12:15 4.00 PTST 2 FLOWED WELL BACK TO CLEAN UP WELL BORE. PUMPED FLUSH VOLUME
DOWN CSG. CONTINUE ON WITH COMPLETION.

12:15-13:15 1.00 PERF 2 PERF STG#11 WITH 8-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM
CHARGE. SET 3.44" CBP AT 10,410' WITH 3,000 PSI. SHOOT 48 HOLES FROM
10,014' TO 10,386'.

13:15 -14:45 1.50 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #11 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 2,668 BBLS LINEAR GEL
CARRYlNG99,160 LBS#20/40 CRC SAND. AVG RATE= 49.9 BPM. AVG PSl=
6,585.

14:45-16:15 1.50 PERF 2 PERF STG#12 WITH 8-2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM
CHARGE. SET 3.44" CFP AT 9,670' WITH 2,000 PSI. SHOOT 42 HOLES FROM
9,319' TO 9,640'.

16:15 -17:00 0.75 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #12 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 1,364 BBLS LINEAR GEL
CARRYING 40,645 LBS#20/40 CRC SAND. AVG RATE= 40.5 BPM. AVG PSI=
6,912.

17:00 - 18:00 1.00 PERF 2 PERF STG #13 WITH 7- 2' GUN LOADED 3 SPF, 120* PHASE, 11 GRAM
CHARGE. SET 3.44" CFP AT 8,070' WITH 1,800 PSI. SHOOT 18 HOLES FROM
8,026' TO 8,032'.

18:00 -20:30 2.50 STIM 3 FRAC STAGE #13 WITH 800 GAL. 15% HCL AT 10 BPM, 694 BBLS DELTA GEL
CARRYING 49,450 LBS#20/40 CRC SAND.AVG RATE= 31.0 BPM. AVG PSI=
5,242. RDMO HES AND OWP ELU.

3/25/2008 06:00 - 23:30 17.50 DRL 6 MIRU IPS CTU, LOAD CT WITH 120* F WATER.MU EXPRESS 27/8'
MOTOR/JARS WITH 3.625" 5-BLADE JUNK MILL.TEST STACK TO 8,000 PSI.
RIH AND DRILLOUT 12 PLUGS IN 10 HOURS. TAG PBTD AT 17,212'. PUMP
FINAL10 BBLS SWEEP AND POOH. FLOWING TO SALES THROUGH IPS
EQUIPMENT. RDMO IPS CTU.

3/26/2008 06:00-06:00 24.00 DRL 6 FLOWING TO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT.
3/27/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 6 FLOWING TO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT.
3/28/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 6 FLOWING TO SALES THROUGH IPS
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release:
Rig Name: Rig Number:

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

3/29/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 6 FLOWING TO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT.
3/30/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 6 FLOWING TO SALES THROUGH IPS EQUIPMENT. RDMO FBE. TURN OVER TO

PRODUCTION.
3/31/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 6 FLOWING TO SALES THROUGH PRODUCTION. ND 4 1/16" FRAC HEAD, SENT

TO CAMERON FOR INSPECTION.

CONRDENTIAL
Printed: 6/3/2008 1:49:29
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Operations Summary IRègg a to ¿JG
Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

10/17/2007 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 03 A DRILLTO 540, RUN 13 3/8 CASING 502'
11:30 - 14:30 3.00 05 H CEMEiNTSURVFACECASING CREW

11/2/2007 07:00 -19:00 12.00 01 A RECEIVED 28 LOADS- BOTTOM SUB, 2 LOADS OF MATTING BOARDS, 2 SUB
SPEADERS, BOTH DOG HOUSES, CHOKE MANIFOLD, VOLUME TANK, 2 SUIT
CASE SKIDS, BOTH PUMPS, BOTH WATER TANKS, 1 MOTOR, FUEL TANK,
HOPPER HOUSE, CAT WALK, MIDDLEPIECES OF DERRICK, KOOMY HOUSE,
2 JUCK TUBS, MISC. PIECES TRUCK, PUMP PARTS HOUSE, BOILER,
ANNULARAND OTHER PIECES. SET MATTING BOARDS, DRILLER SIDE SUB,
AND PART OF OFF DRILLER SIDE SUB, SET IN CHOKE HOUSE AND SHAKER
PIT (ONLY HAVE 6 HANDS PUTTING RIG TOGETHER)

19:00 -06:00 11.00 WAIT ON DAY LIGHT TO START TO RIG UP
11/3/2007 07:00 -19:00 12.00 RECEIVED 13 LOADS TODAYTOP SUB, 3 LOADS OF DERRICK, DRILLINGLINE,

WIND WALLS, FLOOR PLATES, BLOCKS, DERRICK STAND, SCR HOUSE, TOP
DRIVE SCR, BOPE (SINGLE, DOUBLE GATE, MUD CROSS), PIPE RACKS,
SUCTION TANK (BAR LINE INSN'T GOING TO WORK TO MUCH RESRICTION),
ALSO GOING TO RE DO FLOW LINETO DRILLWITH AIR, SO IT WON'T WASH
OUT 90'S), --SET TOP SUB AND SPREADERS SET IN, SET IN SHKERS,
SUCTION TANK(PUT UP ALL HAND RAILS UP), HAVE PUSHER, 2 DRILLERS, 4
HANDS)

19:00 -06:00 11.00 WAIT ON DAT LIGHT TO SET IN RIG
11/4/2007 07:00 -19:00 12.00 01 RECEIVED TOP DRIVE AND PIECES, MOTOR, --SET IN LOW PRESSURE

HOUSE, PARTS HOUSE, MUD PUMPS, WINTERIZATION HOUSES, SCR
HOUSE, WATER TANKS, (CAN'T SENT ANY MORE OF PACKAGE #1 MOTOR
HASN'T SHOWED UP YET TOTAL OF MISSING LOADS 4- DRAW TOOL,#1
MOTOR, WIRE TRAY AND SOME MISC. LOAD. WORKING ON FLOW LINETO
DRILLWITH AIR

19:00 - 06:00 11.00 14 E WAIT ON DAY LIGHT
11/6/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A SET IN FLOW LINE, GRASS HOPPER, MOTOR SHEDS, ASSEMBLE DERRICK

(HAVN'T PUT A-LEGS ON YET), SET IN OFF DRILLER DOG HOUSE, LIGHT
POLES AND SHAKE SLIDES ON MUD TANKS, PULL CORDS TO GRASS
HOPPER, HAVE TWO FULL CREWS TODAY

18:00 -06:00 12.00 11 F WAIT ON DAYLIGHTS TO START PUTTING EQUIPMENT TOGETHER
11/6/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 01 A SET IN FUEL TANK, BOILER, GAS BUSTER, DRAWWORKS, PUT A-LEGS ON

DERRICK, ISTALL BRIDEL LINE, KELLYHOSE, FABING ON HOPPER LINES,
TOP DRIVE SADDLE, GAS BUSTER RETURN, STAND FOR FLOW LINE,

18:00 -06:00 12.00 11 F WAIT ON DAY LIGHT TO RIG UP
11/7/2007 06:00 -15:00 9.00 01 TIE ON TO DERRICK WITH CRANES AND RAISE DERRICK TO FLOOR, FIRST 2

PINS TOOK 3 HOURS TO PIN (TIGHT HOLE FOR PIN), TRIED TO UN PIN
A-LEGS HAD TO LAYDOWN A LEGS TO GET PINS OUT OF DERRICK, TOOK 1
1/2 HR.S TO PIN 4 PINS ON A- LEGS, i HR RAISE DERRICK BOARD AND PIN

15:00-18:00 3.00 01 SET IN SUIT CASE FOR KOOMYHOUSE, STAIRS AND LANDINGS, SET IN
SOLIDS CONTROLEQUIPMENT AND BAR HOPPERS, FABBING LINES FROM
FLOW LINE TO BUSTER AND MUD CLEANER

11/8/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 01 A SET IN FLOW EXTENTION, KOOMYHOUSE, HAVING PROBLEMS WITH
COMMUNICATION WITH SCR HOUSE TO CONTROL PANEL ON FLOOR,(THEY
TOOK THE PANEL THAT WAS ON THIS RIG DOWN IN OKC AND PUT IT ON A
RIG SOME WHERE ELSE, THIS CONTROL PANEL WAS IN THE CASPER YARD)
FABING GAS BUSTER LINES, FINISH RIGGING UP SOLIDS CONTROL, SET IN
REST OF STAIRS, RECEIVED TWO LOADS OF COLLARS, AND PIPE TUB OF
DRILL PIPE,SET REST OF FLOOR PLATES IN, STRUNG UP DERRICK WITH
STRING UP CREW

18:00 -06:00 12.00 WAIT ON DAYLIGHT TO RIG UP NEW RIG
11/9/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 01 A FOUND ÞROBLEMIN SCR CONTROLPANEL, SPOOL DRILLING LINE
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/9/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 01 A DRUM AND CINCHED DOWN ON DEAD MAN, DO DERRICK INSPECTION, HELD
DERRICK OFF STAND, RAISED DERRICK (COULD ONLY PIN 1 PIN ON EACH
SIDE- THEY HAD THE SAMEPROBLEM ON 327-THE RIG THAT CAME OUT OF
THE YARD BEFORE THIS ONE, ALSO THEY ONLY PINNED TWO PINS IN OKC
YARD) HOOK UP MUD LINE HOSE FROM SHED TO SUB, RAISE CHOKE
MANIFOLD UP ONE HOLE,SET IN FLARE BOX AND PUT HAND RAILS UP
AROUND RIG, FILLWATER TANK WITH WATER(REPAIR WATER LEAKS
(ALOT OF LEAKS), RECEIVED 3 LOADS OF PIPE (DON'T HAVE HARD BANDING
ON JTS OF PIPE)-UNITS HEAD WELDER SHOULD BE HERE TODAY TO FIX
DERRICK PIN HOLES

18:00 -06:00 12.00 08 E WAIT ON DAYLIGHT TO CONTNUE RIGGING UP
11/10/2007 06:00 -11:30

' 5.50 08 COULDN'T GET DERRICK PINNED (HADTO GET HYDRILICJACKS AND PUSH
DERRICK OUT TO GET TO PIN). COULDN'T CUT OUT AND WELD DERRICK
EARS WHILE STANDING(UNIT WELDER), GOING TO CUT OUT EARS ON NEXT
MOVE AND WELD WHEN DERRICK IS ON GROUND,

11:30 -15:30 4.00 01 A RUN MUD PUMPS WITH OMRON REP. ON LOCATION, WORK ON STEAM
SYSTEM, RIG UP AIR TUGGERS, UNBRIDLED DERRICK RECEIVED 2 LOADS
OF DRILL PIPE, FINISHED WITH FLOW LINETO GAS BUSTER LINE, BUILDING
RETURN LINE FROM BUSTERAND TARGET T'S FOR CHOKE LINES,

15:30 -18:00 2.50 08 LEVEL DERRICK HAD TO TAKE 1/2" SHIMS OUT OF OFF DRILLER SIDE AND
PUT IN 2 1/4" OF SHIMS ON DRILLER SIDE (DERRICK WAS 7" TO DRILLER
SIDE AND 4" TOWARD DRAWWORKS)

18:00 -06:00 12.00 11 F WAIT ON DAYLIGHTS
11/11/2007 06:00 -13:00 7.00 01 A INSTALL RAILING FOR BOPE HANDLING SYSTEM AND CRAWLERS, RIG UP

TONGS, PLACE WIRE LINE MACHINE ON FLOOR, CUT BOARDS FOR
RACKING AREA, RAISE CHOKE MANIFOLD, FABBING FLARE LINES, GAS
BUSTER VENT LINE, WORK ON STEAM SYSTEM AROUND RIG

13:00 -20:00 7.00 08 TRY TO CENTER DERRICK OVER WELL, FROM MAINSUPPORT BRACE TO
TOP OF CRAZY WHEEL BRACE IS 2 1/2 INCHES DIFFERNCE--ODS 53 3/4" DS
51 1/4", HAVE 2 1/4" SHIMS ON MAINSUPPORTS DRILLER SIDE

20:00 -06:00 10.00 08 WAIT ON DAYLIGHTS (UNIT SHUT DOWN FOR THE NIGHT, NEEDS WELDER
TO WELD PLATE FOR PORTA POWER TO PICK ADJUSTER LEVEL)

11/12/2007 06:00 -09:30 3.50 08 CENTER BLOCKS OVER WELL, WAS GETTING CLOSE, WIND BREEZE CAME
UP PUSHING BLOCKS, SO STARTED PICKING UP TOP DRIVE

09:30 - 18:00 8.50 01 A WELD COMPENSATER PLATES TO BLOCKS, PICK UP SWIVEL, TOP DRIVE
RAIL,

18:00 -06:00 12.00 12 D WAIT ON DAYLIGHTS
11/13/2007 06:00 -18:00 12.00 01 A FINISH RIG UP TOP DRIVE RAIL, STRING OUT CORDS AND PUT IN SADDLE,

HANG SADDLE, PICK TOP DRIVE TO FLOOR, INSTALLCOMPENSATOR RAMS,
AND HOOK UP CONTROLL PANEL, SET IN STEAM HEATERS, SET IN AIR
PACKAGE {BASIC), CONTINUE FABBINGCHOKE MANIFOLD LINES

18:00 -06:00 12.00 08 E WAIT ON DAYLIGHTS
11/14/2007 06:00-09:30 3.50 01 A SCREW SWlVEL TO TOP DRIVE,(CHILLER OUT IN TOP DRIVE SCR HOUSE),

INSTALLTORQUE BUSHING, STRING CORDS TO TOP DRIVE HOUSE,
09:30-14:30 5.00 01 A RIG TOP DRIVE DRILLER CONTROLL PANEL, ASSEMBLE TOP DRIVE

HYDRILIC LINES, PUT 10" FLARE LINES TOGETHER, PLUMB DIESEL TO
BOILER, FIREBOILER

14:30 - 18:00 3.50 01 A RIG UP TOP DRIVEELECTRIC LINES, INSTAL TURN BUCKLES, CENTER RAIL,
INSTALL FORCED AIR HEATER TUBES, CUT BOARDS FOR RACKING BOARD

18:00 -06:00 12.00 01 A INSTALLSTAND PIPE MANIFOLD, PUT TARP ON TOP DRIVE WIRES,
PRESSURE TEST STEM LINES (FIX LEAKS) TIGHTEN BOLTS ON STAND PIPE,

11/15/2007 06:00 -11:00 5.00 01 A PUT UNION ON SWlVEL (NEED TO BUILDGOOSE NECK TO HOLD HOSE
AWAY FROM UNIT), LAYOUT 4" FLARE LINES, SWITCH AROUND HYDRILIC

2 3:25
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Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/15/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 01 A LINEAND ANTI FREEZE (BOTH ARE CONTAMINATED),TOP DRIVE BLEW A
SEAL IN INTENSIFIER

11:00 - 15:00 4.00 01 A SET IN 400 BBL TANK FOR NACL WATER AND UNLOAD 500 BBL ROLL TANKS
FOR INVERT, CUT CONDUCTOR AND HAMMEROFF CEMENT, RIG UP
HYDRALICLINES TO BOPE LIFT

15:00 -16:30 1.50 08 RE-TEST INTENSIFIER (REBUILT SEALS LEAKEDSTILL)
16:30 -18:00 1.50 14 MAKE FINALCUT AND TWO HOLE WELL HEADWITH CAMERON, LEVEL HEAD

AND WELD HEAD,FABBING FINISHED GAS BUSTERRETURN, ALMOST DONE
WITH 4" LINES,

18:00 -20:00 2.00 08 E STRETCH PIT LINER OUT FOR INVERT TANKS
20:00 - 22:30 2.50 14 STACK SINGLE GATE AND MUD CROSS AND DOUBLE GATE
22:30 -06:00 7.50 08 WAIT ON TOP DRIVE UNIT-INSTALLFLOOR MATS ANDFRONT WIND WALLS,

HOOK UP STEAM HEATER ON RIG FLOOR, CLEAN OUT TRASH OUT OF MUD
TANKS,

11/16/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 08 RIG UP REMOTE KOOMY LINEAND AIR LINE
07:30-10:30 3.00 08 RIG UP AND TORQUE SWIVEL AND TOP DRIVE
10:30 -12-00 1.50 08 SET 500 BBL INVERT MUD TANKS
12:00 - 13:30 1.50 08 REPAIR EATON WATER COOUNG SYSTEM
13:30 -15:00 1.50 08 DISASSMBLE PUMP SKID OFF OF TOP DRIVE UNIT
15:00-18:00 3.00 08 HOOK UP FLARE LINES, MAKE UP HYDRILICLINES FOR BOPE, START TIGOA

FORCED AIR HEATER, AND GEL MUD TANK GATES
18:00 -20:00 2.00 08 RIG UP STEAM LINES IN PUMP SHED ,INSTALL HYDRAULICFITTINGS ON

BOPE FOR KOOMY
20:00-23:00 3.00 08 CHANGE OUT TOP DRIVE CHILLER UNIT WITH BOOM TRUCK
23:00 -00:00 1.00 08 FINISH HOOKING UP STEAM LINES IN PUMP SHED, BUILD BURM AROUND

INVERT STORAGE TANKS
00:00 -03:00 3.00 08 CHANGE HOOKS ON TONG HANGING LINES, AND ADD WEIGHT TO

COUNTER WEIGHTS
03:00 -06:00 3.00 08 ROLL UP PIT LINEER, RIG UP DRILLRS STEAM HEATER, WORK ON COLLING

LEAKON DRAW WORKS, HANG BAILS ONTOP DRIVE
06:00 -

11/17/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 08 BREAK OUT UNION OUT OF SWIVEUWORK ON COOLANT LINES ON
DRAW-WORKS

08:00 -14:00 6.00 08 HELP WELDERS ON FLARELINES AND BUILDBLOW DOWN LINE ON BOILER
14:00 -18:00 4.00 14 PICK UP ANNULAR, BLEW HOSE ON SNUBBING IN TRUCK (BOP LIFTSYSTEM

WON'T PICK UP ANN.), SNUBBING TRUCK BLEW HYDRILIC LINE
18:00 -03:00 9.00 14 INSTALLSPACER SPOOL AND ROT.HEAD, HAD B.C QUICK TEST TORQUE

ALLCONECTIONS, PUT OIL IN KOOMY,AND CONNECT KOOMY LINES, FILL
MUD TANKS HALF FULL AND INSTALLWALK WAYS IN SUB (SCAFOLDING)

03:00 -06:00 3.00 01 A PUT BRACE IN FOR TOP DRIVE RAILAND PICK UP TOOLS AROUND RIG
11/18/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 01 A PUT ELECTIRlC MOTOR ON AGITATOR, TEST ALLMUD LINES (FIX LEAKS),

AND CHECKED ALL AGITATORS
07:00 -15:00 8.00 14 PUT CHOKE LINE IN (NOT TIGHT), CHANGE AROUND BLINDAND PIPE RAMS,

FUNCTION TEST RAMS
15:00 -18:00 3.00 01 A HOOK UP KELLYHOSE ADJUST TRACK, PUT VALVEIN FLOW LINE FOR TRIP

TANK RETURN, UNLOAD MUD PRODUCTS,
18:00 - 21:00 3.00 01 A STRAIGHTEN UPTOPTRACK IN DERRRICK,
21:00-03:00 6.00 01 A HOOKUP FILLUP INLINE,STANDPIPE, GAUGEELEVATORS, GROUND

BUILDINGS, BRING SUBS TO RIG FLOOR, BUILDLINEANDHANGNG CABLES
FOR MUD BOX, BUILD LINEAND HANG PIPE SPINNERS,

03:00 -06:00 3.00 01 A BUILDBLEED OFF LINE ON #2 MUD PUMP, --WELD FABBED 1
EXTENTION-SLIDE FOR SHAKERS, FINISHED CELLER GRATTING,

11/19/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 01 A PUT SAFETY LINE ON TOP DRIVE SERVICE LOOP INDERRICK

0:43:25



Questar E & P Page 4 of 24

Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

11/19/2007 07:00 -09:00 2.00 01 A MOVESCAFOLDING FOR WELDER, PULL FLOOR PLATE AND PREPARE TO
LOWER BOP HANDLINGRAIL

09:00 - 12:30 3.50 08 FIX COOLANT LINE ON TOP DRIVE
12:30 -13:30 1.00 01 A ADJUST COUNTER BALANCE ON TOP DRIVE
13:30 - 15:30 2.00 01 A LOWER BOP HANDLING RAILAND LOAD OUT KELLYPIECES
15:30 -18:00 2.50 01 A RE SET ROTATING HEAD AND SPACER SPOOL (TURN WHERE ITWOULD

FACE STRAIGHT
18:00 -21:00 3.00 01 A FINISH TIGHENING ROTATING HEAD AND ADJUST TOP DRIVE TRACK
21:00 -21:30 0.50 01 A GET MEASURE MENT OF BOPE EQUIPMENT, AND RIG UP GERONIMO LINE
21:30 -00:00 2.50 01 A MAKECABLES TO CENTER BOPE, RIG UP CABLES IN SUB, PULL BOPE TO

CENTER
00:00 -02:30 2.50 01 A RIG UP PULLEY IN DERRRICK FOR WIRE LINEMACHINE,AND PULL CORD
02:30 -04:30 2.00 01 A SET IN YELLOW DOGS AND RUN POWER CORDS
04:30 - 05:30 1.00 01 A ADJUST COUNTRER WEIGHT ON DERRRICK CLIMBER
05:30 -06:00 0.50 01 A CHECK ALLSAFETY EQUIPMENT, AND FILL, UNLOAD WESTERN CHEMICAL

BARRELS
11/20/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A HOOK UP GERONIMO LINE, HELP WELDERS INSTALLORBIT VALVE,TAKE

OUT SCM BOARD IN TOP DRIVE HOUSE AND TROUBLE SHOOT COM
BOARDS INTOP DRIVE HOUSE, HOOK UP PASON AND INTER COM TO
DERRICK, RIG UP YELLOW DOG, AND ROLL #2 MUD PUMP CHECK OILING IN
PUMP CHECKED O.K.

il8:00 - 21:00 3.00 01 A PRESSURE TEST MUD LINES TO 1000 PSI FIX LEAKS, TIGHTEN CAPS ON
PUNPS, UNIONS, ECT.

.21:00
- 23:00 2.00 01 A BUILD ROTATING MANIFOLD, HOOK UP OILER BOX AND HOOK UP FILL UP

LINES
23:00-00:00 1.00 01 A REPLACE SHEIVEON BOPE SNUB, AND RIG UP AND BLOW DOWN KELLY

HOSE
00:00-02:30 2.50 01 A PUT6" DRAIN IN BOTTOM OF GAS BUSTER, TURN FLAPPER IN VENT LINE,

AND INSTALL BOLTS IN FLANGES IN BUSTER
02:30 -04:00 1.50 01 A ADD GROUND RODS AND CABLES WHERE NEEDED AROUND RIG, BUILD

HOESE FOR TRIP TANK
04:00 -06:00 2.00 01 A RE ADJUST GERONIMO LINE, REBUILD AIR MANIFOLD, BLOW DOWN MUD

LINES THRU PUMPS, REPLACE LAYDOWN LINE, CLEAN AND PUT AWAY
TOOLS,WELD- FLOW LINE FINfSHED, HAVE BAR LINE ON TANKS, AND
TROUGHS TO BUILDTO PIT, SAFETY ITEMS AROUND RIG

11/21/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 01 A HOOK UP LINE FOR TRIP TANK, AND INSTALL COM, CHECKOIL LEVELS IN
PUMPS, AND DRAW-WORKS, INSTALLRETURN LINES IN FLARE BOX, MAKE
UP BAR MANIFOLD, RIG UP AIR FOR AIR JAMMERS, REPLACED ECM BOARD
IN TOP DRIVE HOUSE, WORK ON TOP DRIVE COUNTER BALANCE,INSTALL
FOOTING ON WELL HEAD (READY TO CEMENT CELLER)

18:00 -21:30 3.50 01 A PUT DIFFERNT SIZE CABLE ON BOPE CENTERING, AND SNUB CENTER AND
PUT UP SUB TARP AND INSTALLPASON EQUIPMENT ON THE END OF DRUM
SHAFT

21:30 - 23:00 1.50 01 A BUILD DIRT BURM OVER GAS BUSTER LINES AND INSTALLTARGET T ON
THE END OF FLOW LINEAND INSTALLDIFFERNT TROUGHS FOR CENTER
FUGES AND PUT DRAIN ON GAS BUSTER

23:00 -01:30 2.50 01 A INSTALLMOUSEHOLE AND FIND BHA X-OVERS AND PICK TO RIG FLOOR
AND RE PLUMB T-BLOCK ON CHOKE MANIFOLDTO

01:30 -03:00 1.50 01 A REPAIR STEM LEAKS AROUND RIG AND PICK UP TRASHAND TOOLS
AROUND RIG,

03:00-06:00 3.00 01 A RACK BHA AND STRAP AND HOUSE KEEPING AROUND RIG
11/22/2007 06:00 -14:00 8.00 01 A (CALLED AND NOTIFIED BLMOF BOP TEST- RAYARNOLD) FUNCTION TEST

BOPS REPAIR HYD. LEAKS FILLBOTTOM OF CELLAR W/ CMT TO BASE RING,

Printed 5ÑžÄ008
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Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date | From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

11/22/2007 06:00 -14:00 8.00 01 A CALB. PASON MUD VOLUME SYSTEM WITH MUD TANKS, ADJUST LINKTILT
ON TOP DRIVE, START RIGGING UP YELLOW DOGS TO PUMP WATER FROM
UP RIGHT TANKS OR WAIST PIT & FAB. & INSTALLSHAKER CUTTING SLIDES
CONT. TO FRAB. & INSTALLBARITE LINES ON SUCTION TANKS INSTALL
ROT. MOUSE HOLE

14:00 - 18:00 4.00 01 A RIG UP & P/UP TESTING EQUIPMENT
18:00 -06:00 12.00 08 D P/T BOPS ATT.TO TEST UPPER RAMS OBSERVE LOWER RAMS LEAKING @

DOOR REPLACE DAMAGED BONNET RUBBERS ATT. TO TEST U.RAMS BLIND
RAMS LEAKING@ DOORS RE-TIGHTEN BONNET BOLTS & RETEST SAME
LEAKATT. PULL OUT TEST JOINT DRAWWORKS WOULD NOT WORK SHUT
OFF POWER & RE-BOOT SYSTEM STILL NOT OPERATING CALLED UNIT
TECHNICIAN & ELE. DISCUSS OVER PHONE THE PROBLEM THEY WAS
UNABLETO FIX PROBLEM OVER THE PHONE AT THE MOMENT THE
TECHICAN AND ELE. IS IN ROUTETO THE RIG SITE.

11/23/2007 06:00 -18:30 12.50 08 WAIT ON UNITS ELECTRICAN ARRIVED @ 1330 HRS TROUBLE SHOOT
FOUND LOOSE CONNECTION TO POWER SUPPLY GOING TO DRILLER
CONSOLE SWITCH PANEL ( DC MODULE WAS NOT GETTING POWER )

18:30 -22:30 4.00 08 D PULL OUT TEST JOINT & CHANGE OUT BONNET SEAL RUBBERS ON BLIND
RAMS DOORS.

22:30 -03:00 4.50 15 TEST BOPS ANN. LOW 250 PSI HIGH TEST 3500 PSI, ALL RELATED BOPS &
EQUIPMENT TESTED W/ LOW 250 PSI & HIGH 5000 PSI ( SHELL TESTED
BOPS & CHOKE MANIFOLDTO 10000 PSI ) P/TEST SUFACE CASING 1500 PSI

03:00 -06:00 3.00 19 C PICK UP BHA & NEW DRILL PIPE
11/24/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 08 ATTÊMPT TO TORQUE UP BHA CONNECTIONS M/UP TONG LINE ON CAT

HEAD WAS TO LONG RECUT & ATT. TO TORQUE UP FIRST CONNECTION
BLOW HYDRAULICHOSE ON M/UP CAT HEAD CYLINDER REPLACE HYD.
HOSE

11:00 -15:00 4.00 06 J M/UP BIT ON NEW SUBS & COLLARS ( M/UP & BREAK OUT NEW
CONNECTION TWICE DUE TO NEW BHA )

15:00-03:00 12.00 06 P/UP NEW DRILLPIPE TORQUE UP BREAK LOOSE & RE-TORQUE ALL
CONNECTION ( TOTAL DRILLPIPE P/UP & IN DERRICK2104')

03:00 -06:00 3.00 08 DRAWWORKS STOP WORKING ( LOST POWER SUPPLY TO DC MODULE )
11/25/2007 06:00 - 14:00 8.00 08 REPAIR DRAWWORKS LOST POWER TO DC MODULE

14:00 -06:00 16.00 06 P/UP NEW 5' DRILL PIPE TORQUE UP & BREAK OUT & RE-TORGUE ALL
CONNECT.
AND RACK BACK IN DERRICK ( TOTAL 53 STDS IN DERRICK )

11/26/2007 06:00 -20:00 14.00 06 PICK UP NEW HWDP & TORQUE UP & BREAK OUT & M/UP R1HW/ 12 1/4 BHA
TAG TOP OF CMT. 469'

20:00 -21:00 1.00 25 DRILLOUT CMT. F/ 469' TO TOP OF L/C @476' BRAKES SYSTEM NOT
WORKING UNABLE TO MAINTAINCORRECT BIT WT

21:00 -06:00 9.00 08 ATT. TO WORK STRING AND ADJUST AIR RELAYVALVETO CONTROL DRILL
STRINGSPEED ( CALL UNITS SUP. & MECH.) WAIT ON MECH.

11/27/2007 06:00 -06:00 24.00 08 ON UNITS TIME( DRAWWORKS NOT WORKING PROPERLY BRAKESNOT
HOLDING TROUBLE SHOOT FOR THE PAST 24 HOURS WITH RIG SUP. &
TOOLPUSHER REPLACE HYD HOSES THAT WAS LEAKINGGOING TO HYD.
BRAKE CONTROL & BOTH AIR RELAY VALVE& CONTROL VALVEON DRILLER
CONSOLE ATT. TO WORK STRING STILL BRAKE NOT HOLDING STRING WT
PROPERLY ( WAIT ON UNITS HEAD MECHANIC )

11/28/2007 06:00 -13:00 7.00 08 REPAIR DRAWWORKS - REMOVE QUICK RELEASE @ EATON BRAKE TO
STOP AIR FROM DUMPING QUICKLYPER EATONS RECOMONDATION WHICH
WAS CAUSING THE BRAKE TO OPERATE ERRATICLY REPLACED H-4 VALVE
REPLACED RELAYVALVE , EXTENDED BRAKE HANDLE6"

13:00 -15:30 2.50 02 D DRILLOUT SHOE TRACK & 15' 12 1/4 HOLE

Printed: 5/22/2008 10:43:25
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Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328
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11/28/2007 15:30 - 16:00 0.50 08 E FIT EQUIVALENTTEST TO 10.5 PPG
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 25 HOLD SAFETY MEETING W/ BASIC AIR CREW & RIG CREWS
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 05 A DRILLOUT RAT HOLE FI SHOE TO 540'
18:00 -18:30 0.50 25 HOLD SAFETY MEETING W/ BASIC AIR CREW & RIG CREWS
18:30 - 22:30 4.00 03 A DRILLF/ 540' TO 676' ( 136' @34' FPH ) 2000 +/- CFM, ATT. TO MAINTAIN20

WOB
22:30 -23:00 0.50 25 STOP DRILLINGPICKUP & WORK ON BASIC ( AIR ) PUMP
23:00 -02:30 3.50 03 A DRILLFI 676' TO 81T ( 141' @41' FPH ) 2000+/- CFM WOB 20
02:30 -03:00 0.50 25 PICK UP &WORK ON BASIC ( AIR ) PUMP
03:00 - 06:00 3.00 03 A DRILLF/ 81T TO 940' ( 123' @41' FPH ) 2000 +/- CFM WOB 20

11/29/2007 06:00 - 13:30 7.50 03 A DRILLF/ 940'TO 1284' ( 344' @45.8' FPH ) WOB 15-20 CFM 1950 +/-

13:30 -16:00 2.50 05 CIR. HOLE CLEAN FLOW LINE & FLARE BOX FULL OF CUTTING REMOVE
CUTTING

16:00 -06:00 14.00 03 A DRILLF/ 1284' TO 1820' ( 536' @38.2' FPH )WOB 10 CFM 2000 +/-

11/30/2007 :06:00 - 07:30 1.50 02 DRILLFl 1815' TO 1861' ( 46' @30.6 FPH ) WOB 15 2000 +/- CFM
07:30 - 10:00 2.50 06 TRIP TO 1420'
10:00 -12:00 2.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE REAMED LAST TWO STDS
12:00 - 18:00 6.00 02 AIR DRILL12 1/4" HOLE Fl 1861' TO 2085' ( 224' @373 )WOB 15 2000 +/- CFM
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 02 AIR DRILL12 1/4" HOLE Fl 2085' TO 2149' ( 64' @64' ) WOB 25-34 2000 +/- CFM
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 02 RIG SERVICE
20:00 -00:00 4.00 02 AIR DRILL12 1/4" HOLE FI 2149' TO 2384' (235' @59' )WOB 22-32 2000 +/- CFM
00:00 -01:00 1.00 08 E STOP DRILLINGBOLT FELL OUT OF DERRICK ( INSPECTED DERRICK FOUND

BOLT WORK LOOSE ON TOP DRIVE RAIL)TOP CLAMP INSTALL BOLT
TORQUE SAME AND FOUND TO MORE LOOSE ON CLAMP

01:00 -04:30 3.50 03 A AIR DRILL2384' TO 252T ( 143' @41') WOB 20- 32 2000 +/- CFM
04:30 -05:30 1.00 02 MAKECONNECTION ATT. TO CIR.HOLE PACKED OFF, BLEED PRESSURE

OFF ATT. TO ROTATE STRING TOP DRIVE STOP WORKING, SET DRILL PIPE
SLIPS TURN STRING FREED & CIR. FOR 15-MIN. ( FOUND TOP DRIVE
BREAKER OFF IN SCR HOUSE )

05:30 -06:00 0.50 05 CIR. HOLE CLEAN @252T
12/1/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 02 AIRDRILLED F/ 252T TO 2622' (95' @95' FPH ) WOB 20TO 35 2100 +/- CFM

07:00 - 16:00 9.00. 06 MAKEDA CONNECTION ATT. TO CIR HOLE PACKED OFF BACK REAM (
SLOWLY TO 2574' UNTIL ESTRABLISH CIR. ( TIGHT HOLE @2598'& 2586')

16:00 - 19:00 3.00 05 WORK STRING & CIR. HOLE CLEAN @2574'
19:00 -20:00 1.00 03 REAM BACKTO BOTTOM F/ 2574' TO 2622' ( OBSERVED TRONA WATER

FLOW )
20:00 -20:30 0.50 02 ATT. TO DRILLTAG BOTTOM STRING STALLED OUT PICK UP OFF BOTTOM

OBSERVED FOR RETURNS ONLY ( WATER NO FOAM RETURNS )
20:30 -00:00 3.50 25 SAFETY MEETING WITH CREW & LINE UP STAND PIPE MANIFOLD ON AIR &

MUD PUMPS ATT. TO PUMP WITH MUD PUMPS ( BLOW POP OFF VALVE)
ATT. TO RUN #2 MUD PUMP W/80 SPM ( PUMP AIR LOCK )WORK ON BOTH
PUMPS REPAIR # 1 MUD PUMP & CIR. W/ #2 PUMP THROUGH BLEED OFF
LINETO TANKS TO GET AIR OUT OF SYSTEM ( NOTE: MUD PROBLEM WAS
DUE TO TRYING TO PUMP WATER FROM THE WATER PIT WHICH WAS CON.
W/ FOAM ( DISCUSS W/ MUD E. TO TRANFER PIT WATER TO TANK #4 AND
TREAT FIRST AND AFTER TRANSFER TO SUCTION TANK

00:00 -06:00 6.00 02 DRILLF/2670' TO 2830' ( 160' @2T FPH ) NOTE: TOP DRIVE GETTING HOT
CAUSING TO P/U OFF BOTTOM & RE-SET BREAKER ) TOP DRIVEENG. IS ON
SITETROUBLE SHOOTING THEPROBLEM

12/2/2007 06:00 -10:30 4.50 05 MAKEMOUSEHOLE CONNECTION & ATT. TO CIR HOLE PACKED OFF WORK
STRING ATT. TO ESTABLISH CIR. W. NO SUCCESS

10:30 -17:30 7.00 03 BACK REAM Fl2814' TO 2754' DUMPED 5 GAL POLYMER, 3 GAL. SOAP
PRESSURED UP TO 1250 PSI W/ AIR

erinied:5/22ÑOO8 10:43:25
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code " Description of Operations

12/2/2007 17:30 - 18:00 0.50 05 PIPE CAME FREE & GOT RETURNS CIR HOLE CLEAN W/ 194 GPM RESERVE
PIT WATER & 1600 CFM OF AIR @400 PSI WHILE MUDDING UP

18:00 -20:00 2.00 05 CIR. Wl#2 PUMP @45 SPM AIR 400 CFM STD PIPE 352 PSI
20:00 -20:30 0.50 05 SHUT AIR OFF BROUGHT#1 & #2 PUMPS ON LINE @40 SPM 8.4 PPG @352

GPM
20:30 - 22:00 1.50 05 GOT RETURNS FLUSHING AIR OUT OF HOLE @ PUMPS #1 &#2 @45 SPM

397 GPM
22:00 -03:00 5.00 05 CIR. & RAISE MUD WT
03:00 -06:00 3.00 08 TOP DRIVE STOP ROTATING LOST POWER TO UNIT STILL CIR. HOLE &

RAISE MUD WT.
12/3/2007 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 05 BUILDMUD & CIR. RAISE MUD WT TO 9.2 PPG

18:00 -00:00 6.00 05 CONT.TO CIR. & INCREASE MUD WT TO 9.5 PPG
00:00-01:30 1.50 06 PUMP PILLTOOH PULLED TIGHT @2445'
01:30 -06:00 4.50 03 BACK REAMING F/ 2445' TO 2105'

12/4/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 03 BACK REAMING F/ 2121' TO 2048' ( PIPE STUCK @2048')
07:30 -09:30 2.00 03 PIPE GOT STUCK WORK STUCK PIPE JAR DOWN ON PIPE FREE PIPE
09:30 - 18:00 8.50 03 BACK REAMING F/ 2048' TO 1365' ( NOTE: USING VERY HIGH HYD. PRESSURE

TO BREAK OUT CONNECTIONS )
18:00 -21:30 3.50 03 BACK REAMING F/ 1365' TO CASING SHOE FLOW CHECK - OK
21:30 - 23:00 1.50 06 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO SURFACE
23:00 - 00:00 1.00 06 J LAYDOWN IBS & BREAK OUT 12 1/4 BIT
00:00 -06:00 6.00 08 REPAIR DRAWWORKS ( EATON BRAKEPISTON SYSTEM )

12/5/2007 06:00-06:30 0.50 08 WORK ON EATON BRAKE
06:30 -10:00 3.50 06 TRIP IN HOLE W/ NEW 12 1/4 BIT TAG RESISTANCE @ 566'
10:00 -00:00 14.00 03 WASH & REAM F/ 565' TO 2749'
00:00 -02:30 2.50 05 CIR. & CLEAN HOLE PUMPING SWEEPS FOR SURVEY
02:30 -03:00 0.50 10 SURVEY @2648' 1/4* DEG. DIR. 351.3 TVD @2648'
03:00 -05:00 2.00 03 WASH & REAM F/2749' TO BOTTOM @2830'
05:00 -06:00 1.00 02 DRILLF/ 2830' TO 2870' ( 40' @40' FPH ) WOB 25 RPM 120

12/6/2007 06:00 -09:30 3.50 03 A DRILLFROM 2862 TO 2902 (ROP 11.4' HR)(LOST POWER TO RIG-COULDN'T
CIRCULATE, ROT, PICK UP OFF BOTTOM)

09:30 - 10:30 1.00 08 REPAIR BLOWN FUSE IN PLC PANEL IN SCR AND BLOWN FUSE IN DRILLER
CONSOLE

10:30 - 13:30 3.00 03 BACK REAM FROM 2902 TO 2850/ PACKED OFF AND COULDN'T CIRCULATE
LOST APROX. 300 BBL.S TO TRYING TO CIRCULATE, REGAINED
CIRCULATION

13:30-14:00 0.50 25 RE INSTALLROTATING HEAD, PULLED THRU FLOOR WHEN BACK REAMING
14:00 - 15:30 1.50 05 CIRCULATEWITH #2 PUMP WORK PIPE TO BOTTOM AND REPAIR POP OFF

ON #1 PUMP
15:30 - 20:00 4.50 02 DRILLFROM 2902 TO 2962 (ROP 13.3' HR) WOB 20-30, DIFFERNT ROT.

SPEEDS,
20:00-21:00 1.00 08 CIRCULATE AND TIGHTEN TURN BUCKLES IN DERRICK TORQUE TUBE

SWAYlNG ALOT NEED TO PUT MORE TURN BUCKLES, TO STIFFEN THE
TORQUE TUBE UP

21:00 -06:00 9.00 02 DRILLFROM 2962 TO 3075 (ROP 12' HR) CUT BACK ON PUMP STROKES
STARTED LOSSING MUD 50 BBLS HR. BEEN PUMPING 15% LCM SWEEPS
REGAIN ALLMOST TOTAL RETURNS (TOTAL LOSSES 350 BBLS)

12/7/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 02 DRILLFROM 3075 TO 3151
10:30 -11:00 0.50 07 RIG SERVICE (TOP DRIVE AND BLOCKS AND SWlVEL)
11:00 -13:30 2.50 02 DRILL FROM 3131 TO 3154, HAD EXESIVE TORQUE, WHEN BUILDINGPILL TO

TRIP OUT, ALL RETURNS---THE BRAKE DOES SLACKS OFF GOOD FOR A
WHILE(COUPLE HR.S,THEN QUITS TOTALY THEN WHEN DRILLERGOES TO
ADJUST AIR CONTROL REGULATER IT SLACKS OFF 20K-30K OVER
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Description of Operations

12/7/2007 11:00 - 13:30 2.50 02 WOB
13:30-20:00 6.50 05 C LOST CIRCULATION PULLED AND RACKED BACK ONE STAND, WORK PIPE

AND BUILDAND PUMP 15% LCM SWEEP (100 BBL), REGAIN PARTAIL
RETURNS, PUMPED 35% LCM SWEEP AND REGAINED RETURNS-HOLE
TOOK 1500 BBL DRINK. BUILDVOLUMETO TRIP OUT

20:00 -21:30 1.50 05 CIRCULATE WHILE BUILDINGPILL FOR TRIP, HAD PROBLEMS WITH VALVES
AND WITH PUMPS FOR HOPPERS, BUILD 1#OVER PILL

21:30 -22:00 0.50 10 DROP SURVEY @3035 .3 DEG, 306.9
22:00 -22:30 0.50 06 TRIP OUT OF HOLE 5 STANDS (HOLE CLEAN NO OVER PULL) TO CHANGE

BIT TO PICK UP HC-605 AND MUD MOTOR
22:30-23:00 0.50 25 PULL ROTATING HEAD, AND BLOW DOWN KELLYHOSE
23:00 -03:00 4.00 06 A TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT TIGHT FORM 2403-2219, 1390-1207 AND REST OF

THE WAY OUT OF THE HOLE HADALOT OF DRAG
03:00-04:30 1.50 06 A HANDLE BHA LAYDOWN BIT SUB AND BIT, PICK UP MUD MOTOR (HUNTING

.24) AND NEW BIT
04:30 -06:00 1.50 06 A TRIP IN HOLE WITH NEW BIT

12/8/2007 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 06 A TRIP IN HOLE WITH NEW BIT TAGGED BRIDGE @2219 TO 2260 WASHED
THRU

10:00 - 10:30 0.50 03 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 3071 TO 3154 (5' FILL)
10:30 - 11:30 1.00 02 DRILL FROM 3154 TO 3166 -TRY TO WORK WITH AUTO DRILLER

PERAMETERS SO DRAW WORKS WOULDN'T DUMP WEIGHTON BIT TRYING
TO HOLD 5K ON BIT- GETTING 12-15K BRAKE LETS OUT TO MUCH DRILLING
LINE WHEN BRAKE HANDLEJACKS OFF

11:30 - 12:00 0.50 07 SERVICE TOP DRIVE AND BLOCKS, CROWN, SWIVEL
12:00 - 17:00 5.00 02 DRILLFROM 3166-3219 WORKING DIFFERNT PERAMETERS WITH BRAKE

HANDLE, ALSO PUSHER TALKED TO HEAD MECHANIC IN OKC (MIKE
ALMOND)-WE CHECKED TO SEE 1FHYDRILIC BRAKES WERE BLEEDING
OFF(PRESSURES GOOD), TRIED TO LET THE CONTROL HANDLE TAKE
MORE OF THE WEIGHT BYAJUSTING H4-VALVE, TRIED PUTTING BRAKE IN
25%(NOT HOLDING ENOUGH WITH H4 VALVE-BRAKE),75%(WHAT WE HAVE
BEEN DRILLINGWITH), 100% (WOULDN'T SLACK ANY WEIGHT OFF), HAND
DRILLED-WORKED THE BEST KEPT WITH IN 3K OF DESIRED WEIGHT

17:00 -19:00 2.00 08 DRILL BY HAND AND AUTO DRILLER WITH UNIT SUPT. (ED PHELPS) ON
FLOOR SO HE COULD OBSERVE WHATS GOING ON WITH THE BRAKE, (WE
DISCOVERED THAT THE BRAKEHANDLE HAS TO BE IN A HIGHER POSTION
TO LET OFF WEIGHT DRILLSTRING THAN 180 DEG. ON DRUM (SEEMS THAT
SOMETHING MiGHT BE DRAGGING OR OUT OF BALANCE-BUT THERE ISN'T
ALOT OF VIBIRATIONWHEN TRIPPING)

19:00 -23:00 4.00 06 TRIPPING TO SHOE TO WORK ON BRAKES SO THAT WE CAN HOLD A
CONSTANT W.O.B. (MECHANICS ON THERE WAY FROM PINEDALE AREA-
SHOULD BE HERE THIS A.M.

23:00 -06:00 7.00 08 WAIT ON MECHANIC TO LOOK OVER BRAKES, ARRIVED ON LOCATION @4
AM. MECHANIC LOOKING OVER HYDRILIC BRAKE SYSTEM-MECHANIC
ARRIVED @4 AM

12/9/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 08 TIGHTEN AIR LEAKS ON EATON BRAKE, ON 25% HAD A BAD LEAK,75% HAD2
LEAKS REAL SMALL/RE-POSTION BRAKE HANDLE

07:00 -08:00 1.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE TO 1,210 TAGGED SOILD-HAD PEA GRAVEL COMING BACK
WHEN WASHING THRU

08:00 -09:00 1.00 03 WASH AND REAMFROM 1,210 TO 1,245 WORKED THRU SPOT
09:00 -10:30 1.50 06 TRIP IN TO 3,144 TRIP WAS GOOD (HOLE CLEAN)
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 03 SAFETY WASH FROM 1,245 TO 3,219 HAD 5' FILL
11:00 - 12:00 1.00 08 WORK WITH AIR BRAKE TO SEE IF IT WOULD HOLD CONSTANT WEIGHT

AND SLACK OFF LINE CONSISTANT TRIED DIFFERENT SETTINGS



Questar E & P Page 9 of 24

Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code e Description of Operations

12/9/2007 11:00 - 12:00 1.00 08 BEST (BRAKE25% WITH 35 PSI ON H-4 VALVE)
12:00 - 14:30 2.50 02 DRILLFROM 3,219 TO 3,261 (ROP 16.8) WOB 3-6, ROT 30-40, SPM 75/75,
14:30 -15:00 0.50 08 CHANGE OUT BRAKE RELEASE VALVE(PER UNIT SUPT.)
15:00 - 20:00 5.00 02 DRILLFROM 3261 TO 3,357(ROP 19.2 HR) ,STARTED @3295 SEEPING 10 BBLS

AN HOUR, PUMPING 15% LCM SWEEPS (20 BBLS) EVERY HOUR - PIPE
SHIMMERING -NO TORQUE SHOWING ON TOP DRIVE CONSOLE, AND NO
VISULVERTICAL BOUNCE ON SURFACE-SHAKES DERRICK-GOING TO
CHECK TOP DRIVE ON CONNECTION

20:00-21:00 1.00 07 WORK ON TOP DRIVE CABLES- MAKESURE ALLCABLES ARE
TIGHT(CHECKED OK), CHECK TIMING OF TOP DRIVE MOTORS (CHECKED
OK), OPENEDTOP DRIVE CONTROL BOX AND FOUND SOMELOOSE
WIRES-TOP DRIVE DON'T SHIMMER ANY MORE

21:00 -04:30 7.50 02 DRILLFROM 3,357 TO 3,519( ROP 21.6' HR) HOLE HASN'T TAKEN ANY FLUID
SINCE 3,332

04:30 -05:00 0.50 25 CLEAN SUCTION SCREEN ON #1 PUMP
05:00 -05:30 0.50 25 CLEAN SUCTION SCREEN ON #2 PUMP
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 02 DRILLFROM 3519 TO 3530 (ROP 20' HR) WOB 7, ROT 40, SPM 75/75, NO

LOSSES, BG GAS 15,
12/10/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 02 DRILLFROM 3530 TO 3643 (ROP 22.6' HR) WOB 5-6, ROT 4 50, SPM 85/85,BG

GAS 42 UNITS, SHAKERS STILL BY PASSED , VERY MINIMALPEA GRAVEL
COMING TO SHAKERS,

11:00 -12:00 1.00 11 SURVEY @3565 .3 DEG 231 AZ
12:00 - 16:30 4.50 02 DRILLFROM 3643 TO 3743 (ROP 22.2) SAME PERRAMETERS, PULL SUCTION

SCREENS OUTI PACKING OFF WITM NUT PLUG
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 07 SERVIGE RIG, GREASE BLOCK, SWlVEL, TOP-DRIVE
17:00 -06:00 13.00 02 DRILLFROM 3743 TO 4005 (ROP 20.1) WORK DIFFERNT PERAMETERS HOLE

SEEPING @10 BBL HR
12/11/2007 06:00 -14:00 8.00 02 DRILLINGFROM 4005 TO 4120 (ROP 14.4' HR)

14:00 - 14:30 0.50 07 RIG SERVICE (TOPDRIVE, BLOCKS, SWIVEL, CROWN)
14:30 -23:30 9.00 02 DRILLFROM 4120 TO 4311 (ROP 21.2)
23:30 -00:30 1.00 10 CIRCULATE AND SURVEY .3 DEG 5.1 AZ
00:30 -02:00 1.50 02 DRILLFROM 4311 TO 4327 (ROP 10.6) HAD HIGH PUMP PRESSURE AFTER

CONNECTION

02:00 -02:30 0.50 05 CIRCULATE WELL AND BUILDTRIP SLUG
02:30 -06:00 3.50 06 PUMP TRIP SLUG AND TRIP OUT OF HOLE, PULL 5 STANDS, BLOW DOWN

KELLYHOSE AND PULL ROT. RUBBER, HAD TO BACK REAM FROM 1207 TO
1185

12/12/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 06 A TRIP OUT HOLE TO CHANGE OUT BIT AND MUD MOTOR
08:00 -09:30 1.50 06 J BREAK BIT AND LAYDOWN MUD MOTOR (HUNTING .24) AND PICK UP

MOTOR (HUNTING .16) AND BIT
09:30 -10:00 0.50 06 TRIP IN TO SHOE (502')
10:00 -10:30 0.50 08 FINDGROUND FAULT IN SCR HOUSE (#1TRIP TANK PUMP)
10:30 -11:00 0.50 07 RIG UP CHAINS ON BAILS TO TOP DRIVE, GREASE TOP DRIVE
11:00 -14:00 3.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE HAD TO WASH THRU 1,207 TO 1,235 PEA GRAVEL
14:00 -15:00 1.00 03 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 4,212 TO 4,327
15:00 -06:00 15.00 02 DRILLFROM 4327 TO 4585 (ROP 17.2' HR) WOB 5-10, DHRPM 181, BG GAS 10,

HOLE SEEPING 2-3 BBLS HOUR
12/13/2007 06:00 -13:30 7.50 02 DRILLFROM4585 TO 4691(ROP 14.1' HR) PUMPING BIT BALLING 10 BBL

SWEEPS EVERY HOUR
13:30-14:00 0.50 07 RIG SERVICE, TOP DRIVE, DRAW WORKS
14:00 -14:30 0.50 08 REPAIRPOP OFF ON #1 PUMP
14:30 - 16:00 1.50 02 DRILL FROM TO 4691 TO 4730 (ROP 26'
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

12/13/2007 16:00 -19:00 3.00 05 C LOST TOTAL CIRCULATION PUMP 200BBL 15% LCM PILL, REGAINED PARTAL
RETURNS, PUMPED 25 BBL(2-50# BAG POLY SWELL SWEEP DOWN HOLE),
REGAIN CIRCULATION AND STAGED UP PUMPS (TOTAL LOSSES 275 BBL)

19:00 -00:00 5.00 02 DRILLFROM 4730 TO 4785 (ROP 11' HR)
00:00 -00:30 0.50 08 FIX POP OFF ON#1 PUMP
OO:30- 01:30 1.00 02 DRILLFROM 4785 TO 4795 (ROP 10' HR)
01:30 -02:00 0.50 25 RE CALIBRATE HOOK LOAD AND WEIGHT ON BIT (STRING WEIGHT JUMPED

TWO TIMES WEIGHT- DRILLTRIED TO RE CALIBRATE ON CONNECTION ARE
DIDN'T DO IT RIGHT-HES NEVER WORK WITH A PASON BEFORE)

02:00 -06:00 4.00 02 DRIL FROM 4795 TO 4860 (ROP 16.25' HOUR)WOB 10-15, SPM 80/80, BG GAS
25, SEEPING 10 BL HR

12/14/2007 06:00 -07:30 1.50 02 DRILLFROM 4860 TO 4871 HAD PUMP PRESSURE GAIN AND MOTOR
WANTING TO STALL (TORQUE), WENT TO PULL SCREEN IN DRILL PIPE AND
SCREEN WAS MISSING STRAINER PORTION

07:30-08:30 1.00 05 CfRCULATE, BUILDTRIP SLUG, FILLTRIP TANK
08:30-14:30 6.00 06 PUMP TRIP SLUG AND TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR DRILL PIPE SCREEN,

CHANGE BITAND MOTOR-HAD 4 CONNECTIONS THAT WERE TIGHT-DRILL
PIPE SCREEN WAS FOUND IN CROSS OVER FROM 4 1/2 IF TO 4 1/2 XH(ON
TRIP OUT OR IN DIDN'T SEE ANYTHING 1200-HOLE WAS IN GREAT SHAPE)'

14:30-16:00 1.50 06 J HANDLE BHA CHANGE OUT MOTOR AND BIT
16:00 -17:00 1.00 06 TRIP INTO SHOE 502' ANDTEST MUD MOTOR
17:00 -21:00 4.00 06 TRIP INTO HOLE BREAK CIRULATION EVERY 2 ROWS (20 STANDS) TO 4786
21:00 -21:30 0.50 03 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 4786 TO 4871
21:30 -03:00 5.50 02 DRILLFROM 4871 TO 4980 (ROP 19.8) WOB 5-12, RPM 40, DHRPM 125, MW 9.7

VIS 40, BG GAS 35 UNITS TRYING TO CONTROL SLIP STICK
03:00 -04:00 1.00 10 SURVEY @4900, .2 DEG, 216 AZ
04:00 -06:00 2.00 02 DRILLFROM 4980 TO 5000 ( ROP 10' HR) WOB 10, RPM 40, DHRPM 125

12/15/2007 06:00 - 15:00 9.00 02 DRILLFROM 5,000 TO 5,075 (ROP 8.4) WORKED ALL DIFFERNT PERAMETERS
TO GET BIT TO DRILL(NOTHING WORKS) PUMPING BIT BALLINGSWEEPS,
PUT SAPP DOWN DRILL PIPE, FRESH WATER SWEEP HAD HAVE SOME SLIP
STICK

15:00 - 15:30 0.50 07 SERVICE TOP DRIVE AND BLOCKS
15:30-16:30 1.00 05 MIXTRIP SLUG AND PUMP SLUG TO TRIP OUT
16:30 -22:00 5.50 06 TRIP OUT OF HOLE BIT QUIT DRILLING
22:00-23:00 1.00 06 J HANDLE BHA LAYDOWN MUD MOTOR, BIT AND PICK UP NEW,MOTOR, BIT
23:00 -03:30 4.50 06 A TRIP IN HOLE AND TEST MUD MOTOR, FILLEVERY 2 ROWS
03:30 -04:00 0.50 03 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 4,980 TO 5,075 NO FILL
04:00 -06:00 2.00 02 DRILLFROM5075 TO 5110 (ROP 17.5' HR)WOB 5, DHRPM 210, MW 9.8 VIS 41

12/16/2007 06:00 -16:30 10.50 02 DRILLINGFROM 5, 110 TO 5,171 (ROP 5.8' HR) TRYING ALL DIFFERNT
PERAMETERS, PUMPING BITBALLSWEEPS, LOOKING AT OFF SETS WELLS
IN THIS AREA DRILLEDAS SLOW (11" HOLEDRILLED @6.3' HR THRU THIS
SECTION), 80 % SHALE, 10 % SILTSTONE,10% SAND STONE, TRACE OF
LIMESTONE

16:30 -17:00 0.50 07 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE, BLOCK AND SWIVEL
17:00 -06:00 13.00 02 DRILLFROM5,171 TO 5,239 (ROP 5.2' HR) PUMPING BIT BALLINGSWEEPS ,

TRYING ALLDIFFERNTPERAMETERS
12/17/2007 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 02 DRILLFROM 5239 TO 5267 (ROP 5.6' HR) WORK DIFFERNT PERAMETERS AND

PUMP BIT BALLINGSWEEPS, SAPP DOWN DRILLPIPE (DRILLING STEADY AT
5'-6' AN HOUR

11:00 - 11:30 0.50 07 SERVICE RIG, BLOCKS, SWIVEL, TOP DRIVE, DRAW TOOL
11:30 - 12:30 1.00 08 CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB AND FIX LINER WASHER ON #2 MUD PUMP (HOSE)
12:30 - 18:30 6.00 02 DRILL FROM5267 TO 5293 (ROP 4.3) ROP DROPPED TO 3-4' HR- HADA

LITTLETORQUEI

8 10:43:25
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

12/17/2007 18:30 - 19:00 0.50 05 CIRCULATE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE AND BUILDTRIP SLUG
19:00 -23:30 4.50 06 A PUMP SLUG ANDTRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CHANGE BIT, (CHECKED FLOW- NO

FLOW,BLEW DOWN KELLYHOSE, CIRCULATE CHARGE PUMPS
23:30-00:00 0.50 06 IJ CHANGE OUT BIT AND CLEAN RIG FLOOR FOR TRIP IN HOLE
00:00-02:00 2.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE
02:00-04:30 2.50 08 REPLACE BROKEN CABLE ON EASY TORQUE
04:30 -05:30 1.00 06 TRIP IN HOLE
05:30 -06:00 0.50 08 i EASY TORQUE CABLE FELL OFF SHEIVE, PUT CABLE ON SHEIVE

12/18/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 06 A TRIP IN HOLE
08:00 -08:30 0.50 03 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 5173 TO 5293 NO FILL
08:30 -14:00 5.50 02 BREAK BIT IN DRILL FROM 5293 TO 5360 (ROP 12.2) WOB 3-6, DHRPM 210-245,

MW 9.8 VIS 43, BG GAS9, PUT MORE WT BIT WANTS TO STICK SLIP
(TORQUE STARTS JUMPING),

14:00 - 14:30 0.50 07 SERVICE RIG--TOP DRIVE (TOOK OIL SAMPLE), SWIVEL, BLOCKS
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 08 COULDM'T GET #2 PUMP TO KlCK IN AFTER CONNECTION, TROUBLE SHOOT

OILER PUMP KICKED BREAKER- RESET BREAKER
15:00 -06:00 15.00 02 DRILLFROM 5360 TO 5485 (ROP 8.3' HR) WORKING ALL DIFFERENT

PERAMETERS
12/19/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 02 DRILLFROM 5485 TO 5495 (ROP 5' HR)TRY ALL DIFFERNT PERAMETERS- 5-20

WOB, 30-65 ROTARY, SLOWED PUMP DOWN TO 75 STRKS, COULDN'T GET
TO DRILL(WANTING TO STALL OUT-SLIP STICKING)

08:00 -08:30 0.50 05 CIRCULATE AND BUILDTRIP SLUG
08:30 -09:00 0.50 10 DROP SURVEY .2 DEG 258.6 DEG
09:00 -13:30 4.50 06 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CHANGE BIT AND MUD MOTOR-BLEW KELLY HOSE

DOWN
13:30 -15:30 2.00 06 J HANDLE BHA, LAYDOWN AND PICK UP NEW MOTOR, AND BIT, CLEAN

FLOOR FOR TRIP IN HOLE, TRIP TO SHOE
15:30 - 16:00 0.50 07 RIG SERVICE AND CHANGE AIR LINES ON EATON BRAKE CONTROLS (STEEL

BRAIDED)
16:00 -19:30 3.50 06 TRIP IN HOLE FILLPIPE @BHA AND EVERY 30 STANDS
19:30 - 20:30 1.00 03 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 5,355 TO 5,495-THERE WAS 8' OF UNDER

GAGE HOLE
20:30 -06:00 9.50 02 DRILLFROM 5 495 TO 5,550 WORKING ALL DIFFERNT PERAMETERS,

PUMPING BIT BALLINGSWEEPS, HAVE ALOT OF SLIP STICK TRY TO WORK
PERAMETERS YO RID SLIP STICK, SLIP STICK WON'T GO AWAY

12/20/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 5,550 TO 5,556 ( ROP 3' HR) WORK DIFFERNT PERAMETERS TO
GET TO DRILLANDSTOP SLIP STICKING

08:00-08:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND BUILDTRIP SLUG
08:30 -12:00 3.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO PICK UP CONE BIT
12:00-14:00 2.00 RIG 6 CUT & SLIP DRILLLINE
14:00 -19:30 5.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE FILLSTRING @570', 1957 & 4120' W/ NO RESISTANCE
19:30 -20:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM F/ 5,366' TO BOTTOM @5,556' W/ NO PROBLEMS
20:00 -01:30 5.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 5,556' TO 5,596' ( 40' @7.3 FPH ) WOB 5/35
01:30 -02:30 1.00 OTH REMOVE LCM FROM SUCTION LINE ON #2 MUD PUMP
02:30 - 06:00 3.50 DRL 1 DRILLFl 5,596' TO 5,638' ( 42' @12 FPH ) WOB 32/40

12/21/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 5,638' TO 5,647' ( 9' @9' FPH ) WOB 36, RPM 105
07:00-07:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
07:30 - 18:00 10.50 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 5,64T TO 5,735' ( 88' @8.4' FPH ) WOB 30/40, RPM 90/110
18:00 -06:00 12.00 DRL 1 DRILLFI 5,735' TO 5,830' (95' @8' FPH ) WOB 30/40, RPM 90/110 MUD WT 9.7

VIS 42, W/ NO LOSSES
12/22/2007 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 5,830' TO 5,837' ( T @4.7 FPH ) WOB 35/40 RPM 90/110 MUDWT 9.7

07:30 -08:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
08:00 - 17:00 9.00 DRL 1 DRILLFI 5,83T TO 5,912' (75' @8.3 FPH ) WOB 36/40 RPM 110 MUDWT 9.7

P 22/2008 10:43:25
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

12/22/2007 17:00 -18:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIR. BOTTOMS UP DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL
18:30 -20:30 2.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO BHA
20:30 -03:00 6.50 ISP 1 INSPECT ALLBHA ( FOUND NO DEFECTS)
03:00 -03:30 0.50 TRP 1 CLEAN RIG FLOOR & CHANGE OUT BIT
03:30 -06:00 2.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE W/ NEW 12 1/4 BIT

12/23/2007 06:00 -09:00 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE Wl NEW BIT FILLPIPE EVERY 2000' ATT. TO FILLPIPE @4120'
STRING PLUGGED

09:00 - 13:30 4.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE (WET ) DUE TO PLUGGED STRING ( FOUND TWO FEET
OF LCM IN MONEL FROM FLOAT VALVE UP & ATT. TO TO DRAIN MUD MOTOR
W/ NO SUCCESS MOTOR WOULD NOT TURN.

13:30 -14:00 0.50 TRP 1 LAYDOWN OLD MOTOR REPLACE WITH NEW MOTOR
14:00 -17:30 3.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 539' CIR. 10 MINUTES -OK FILLPIPE @1766', 3258' &4501'
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 TRP 2 INSTALLROTATE HEAD & TRIP IN HOLE TO 5,74T
18:00 -19:00 1.00 REAM i WASH & REAM F/ 5,747' TO 5,889' W/ NO RESISTANCE FI 5,889' TO BOTTOM @

5,912' W/ 2 TO 5 WOB.
19:00 -06:00 11.00 DRL 1 DRILLFl 5912' TO 6,002' ( 90' @8.2 FPH ) WOB 28 TO 35, RPM 90/110, MUD WT

9.7 VIS 42
12/24/2007 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 6,002' TO 6,026' ( 24' @S' FPH ) WOB 32-40 RPM 105 MUD WT. 9.7 VIS

42
09:00 -09:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE & HELD BOP DRILL
09:30 - 18:00 8.50 DRL 1 DRILL FI 6,026' TO 6,100' ( 74' @8.T FPH) WOB 32/40 RPM 105 MUD WT 9.7 VIS

41
18:00 -21:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 6,100' TO 6,120' ( 20' @6.T FPH ) WOB 35/40 RPM 105 MUD WT 9.7VIS

42
21:00 -22:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIR. BOTTOMS UP & PUMP SLUG
22:00 -01:00 3.00 TRP 2 TOOH TO 3,129' LOST POWER TO DC MODULETO DRILLERPANEL
01:00 -06:00 5.00 RIG 2 TROUBLE SHOOT &WAIT ON UNITS ELE.

12/25/2007 06:00 -06:00 24.00 RIG 2 WORK PIPE & WAIT ON UNITS ELECTRICAN REMOVE BAD HYD. MOTOR &
WAIT ON REPLACEMENT MOTOR ( MOTOR ARRIVED ON LOCATION @2130
HRS. ATT. TO INSTALLMOTOR WRONG MOTOR HOUSING ) CALLED
AROUND FOUND HYD. MOTOR IN CASPER WAITING ON MOTOR COMING F/
CASPER SHOULD BE ON LOCATION @0830 HRS.

12/26/2007 06:00 -17:00 11.00 RIG 2 WAITING ON HYD. MOTOR REPLACEMENT - MOTOR ARRIVED @ 1100 HRS,
WRONG SHAFT SIZE ( FRAB. A COUPLE INSTALLED SAME ) FRANKS HAWK
JAW TONGS ARRIVED @ 1530 HRS R/UP SAME

17:00 -19:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
19:00-20:00 1.00 TRP 2 CHANGE OUT BIT & MOTOR
20:00 -02:00 6.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE W/ NEW BIT & MOTOR TO 5,942'
02:00 -03:00 1.00 REAM 1 WASH & REAM FI5,942' TO BOTTOM 6,120' W/ NO RESISTANCE
03:00 -06:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILLFI6,120' TO 6,143' ( 23 @7.7 FPH ) WOB 35/40 RPM 115 MUD WT. 9.6 VIS

39 W/ NO LOSSES
12/27/2007 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 6,143' TO 6,225' ( 82' @ 11.T FPH ) WOB 34/40 MUD WT 9.8 VIS 39

13:00 - 13:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:30 - 18:00 4.50 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 6,225' TO 6,275' ( 50' @ 11.1' FPH ) WOB 35/40 MUDWT 9.8 VIS 41
18:00 -02:00 8.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 6,275' TO 6,375' ( 100' @ 12.5' FPH ) WOB 35/40 MUD WT 9.8 VIS 40
02:00 -02:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIR. BOTTOMS UP
02:30 -05:00 2.50 TRP 15 SHORT TRIP TO 5,905' RlH TO BOTTOM @6,375'
05:00 -06:00 1.00 CIRC 1 PUMP SWEEP & CIR. HOLE CLEAN

12/28/2007 06:00 -08:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIR. & CONDITION HOLE FOR RUNNING 9 5/8" CASING
08:00 -08:30 0.50 SUR 1 DROP MULTI.SHOT & PUMP SLUG
08:30 -14:30 6.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE
14:30 - 15:30 1.00 TRP 1 BREAK OUT BIT & LAYDOWN MOTOR & MONEL
15:30 - 16:30 1.00 OTH PULL WEAR BUSHING

Printed: 5/22/2008 10:43:25
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

12/28/2007 16:30 -22:00 5.50 CSG 1 R/UP FRANKS CASING EQUIPMENT & STABBING BOARD & FILLUP TOOL
22:00-00:30 2.50 RIG 2 ATT. TO RIG UP FLAG POLL FOR THE LAYDOWN MACHINE ROTATING

MOUSEHOLE WAS TO BIG FOR THE FLAG POLL ( WAS UNABLETO SECURE
FLAG POLL PROPERLY INSIDE THE R. MOUSEHOLE ) LAYDOWN R.
MOUSEHOLE
GOT CASING MOUSEHOLE FROM RIG 232

00:30-02:00 1.50 CSG 1 FINISH RIGGING UP LAYDOWN MACHINE
02:00 -03:30 1.50 CSG 2 THREAD LOCK SHOE, &TWO JTS OF 9 5/8 CASING & F/C ATT. TO M/UP

i CASING JT TONGS WAS UNABLETO GET PROPER TORGUE ON VAM
CONNECTION

03:30 -06:00 2.50 CSG 1 RIG DOWN TONGS &WAIT ON TONGS FROM FRANKS
12/29/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 CSG 2 RIG UP FRANKS 13 3/8 CASING TONGS

07:00 -21:00 14.00 CSG 2 RUN 9 5/8"CASING ( VAM47 # HC P 110 ) SHOE, TWO JTS CASING & F/C &
TOTAL 145 JTS & LANDINGJT W/ MBS ( SHOE @6,353')

21:00 -00:30 3.50 CIRC 1 CIR. & CONDITION MUD ( SHAKE OUT LCM) R/D FRANKS CSG EQUIPMENT
00:30 -01:30 1.00 OTH LAYDOWN FILLUP TOOL & CHANGE OUT BAILS ON TOP DRIVE
01:30 -05:00 3.50 CSG 2 P/UP 1 STD 5" HWDP FROM DERRICK MlUP PACK OFF ASSEMBLY & RUNNING

TOOL SET PACK OFF ASSEMBLY P/T TO 5000 PSI =OK R/UP HAL RETURN
LINE TO A SECTION OUTLET VALVE.

05:00 -06:00 1.00 CSG 2 PICK UP LANDINGJT & INSTALLSAME & R/UP CMT HEAD & CMT. LINE TO RIG
FLOOR & PREPARE FOR CEMENT JOB.

12/30/2007 06:00 -07:00 1.00 CMT 2 CONT. TO P/UP LANDINGJT. & M/UP CMT TOOL & LAND SAME & R/UP CMT
HEAD AND CMT LINES TO RIG FLOOR

07:00 - 07:30 0.50 RIG i RIG SERVICE
07:30 -09:30 2.00 CMT 2 WAIT ON CAMERON PACK OFF SUPPORT BUSHING & INSTALLSAME
09:30 - 10:30 1.00 CMT 2 HOLD S/MEETING PREPARE FOR CMT. JOB OBSERVE LOSSES
10:30 - 18:00 7.50 CIRC 2 ATT. TO CURE LOSSES PUMP LCM PILLS W/ NO SUCCESS
18:00 -19:00 1.00 CMT 2 REPAIR HAL.FOAM DISCHARGE LINE
19:00 - 00:30 5.50 CMT 2 PUMP 40 BBLS SPACER @5 BBLS/MIN. 10 BBLS FRESH WATER 20 BBLS

SUPER FLUSH 10 BBLS FRESH WATER PUMP SECOND LEAD CMT. 198 BBLS
@5 BPM 14.3 PPG & DROP PLUG DISPLACE Wl466 BBLS ( PLUG DID NOT
BUMP )

00:30 -01:00 0.50 CMT 2 PUMP 55 BBLS CAP CEMENT DOWN BACK SIDE
01:00 -02:00 1.00 CMT 1 RIG DOWN CEMENTERS
02:00 -03:30 1.50 CMT 2 PULL LANDINGJT.
03:30 -06:00 2.50 BOP 2 P/TEST BOPS & CHOKE MANIFOLD

12/31/2007 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 BOP 2 P/TEST BOPS & CHOKE MANIFOLD LOW TEST 250PSI & HIGH TEST 5000 PSI
P/T ANN. LOW TEST 250 PSI & HIGH TEST 3500 PSI W/ NO LEAKS

10:30 -11:00 0.50 BOP 2 INSTALLWEAR BUSHING
11:00 -14:00 3.00 OTH PREPARETO PICK UP 5" DRILL PIPE ATT. TO REMOVE PROTECTORS USING

CHAIN TONGS TO MUCH ICEHEAT PROTECTORS TO REMOVE SAME CLEAN
THREADS & STRAP DRILLPIPE

14:00 - 15:30 1.50 TRP 2 RIG UP LAYTRUCK MACHINE
15:30 - 17:30 2.00 RIG 2 OBSERVE BAD HYDRAULICLEAKON DRAWWORKS FOUND HYDRAULIC

HOSE LEAKINGON DRILLERS OFF SIDE ( REPLACE SAME )
17:30 -18:00 0.50 TRP 2 PICK UP NEW 5" S-135 DRILL PIPE M/U & B/O & M/U ALL NEW DRILLPIPE

CONN.
18:00 -19:00 1.00 RIG 2 FIX HYDRAULICLEAKON MlUP TONG RAM
19:00 -06:00 11.00 TRP 2 PICK UP NEW 5" S-135 DRILLPIPE M/U & B/O & M/U ALL DRILL PIPE

CONNECTIONS
1/1/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE STAND 31 STDS OF S-135 DP

07:30-08:30 1.00 TRP 1 LAYDOWN 8" DRILLCOLLARS
08:30 - 10:30 2.00 OTH PREPARE TO PICK UP 6.5" DRILLCOLLAR, MOTOR, IBS & DRILLPIPE

8 10:43:25
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code C Descriptionof Operations

1/1/2008 10:30 - 14:30 4.00 TRP 1 M/UP PDC & 8 1/2 BHA FILL UP PIPE & BREAK CIR.
14:30 -02:00 11.50 TRP 2 PICK UP NEW G-105 DRILLPIPE TORQUE & B/O & RE-TORQUE
02:00-03:00 1.00 OTH RIG DOWN FRANKS LAYDOWN MACHINE
03:00 -04:00 1.00 TRP 2 RUN INHOLE TO 6183'
04:00 -06:00 2.00 WASH & REAM DN FI6,183' TO LANDINGCOLLAR @6,266'

1/2/2008 06:00 -09:00 3.00 DRL 4 DRILLOUT SHOE TRACK EQUIPMENT
09:00 - 10:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 6,375' TO 6,385'
10:00 - 10:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIR. BOTTOMS UP FOR FIT
10:30 - 11:00 0.50 EQT 2 PERFORM FIT TEST TO 13.5 PPG EQUIVALENT
11:00 - 12:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 6,385' TO 6,425' ( 40' @2T FPH ) WOB 12/14 MUD WT 9.3 VIS 39
12:30 - 13:30 1.00 REAM 1 ATT. TO REAM STAND BEFORE MAKINGMOUSEHOLE CONNECTION LAST 35'

HOLE HAD FELL IN ( WASH & REAM BACKTO BOTTOM THREE TIMES EVERY
TIME SAME RESULTS) CONT. TO WASH & REAM THROUGH THE 35' PUMP
SWEEP AFTER CIR SWEEP HOLE CONDITION WAS GOOD MAKE
CONNECTION

13:30 - 18:00 4.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 6,425' TO 6,550' ( 125' @27.8 FPH ) WOB 12/15 MUD WT 9.6 VIS 42
18:00 -06:00 12.00 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 6,550' TO 6,900' ( 350' @29.2 FPH ) WOB 12/18 MUD WT 9.5 VIS 40 W/

NO LOSSES & NO HOLE PROBLEMS
1/3/2008 06:00 - 17:00 11.00 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 6900 TO 7366 (ROP 42.3' HR) WOB 10-14, DHRPM 98, MW 9.5, BG

GAS 5, HOLE SEEPING 5-10 BBLS HR PUMPING 12% LCM SWEEPS
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @7305 1.3 DEG 147.2 AZ
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE
18:00 -06:00 12.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM7366 TO 7795 (ROP 35.T HR) WOB 10-14, DHRPM 100, MW 9.4, BG

GAS 5, HOLE SEEPING 10 BBL.S HR.
1/4/2008 06:00 - 14:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 7,795 TO 8,034 (ROP 28.1) WOB 10-15, MW 9.3, VIS 43, BG GAS 10,

HOLE SEEPING 10 BBL.S HR. SWEEPING 20 BBL WITH 15% LCM EVERY HR.,
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @7,979-1.8 DEG. 179.4 AZ
15:00 - 15:30 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG TOP DRIVE, BLOCKS, SWlVEL
15:30 -06:00 14.50 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 8,034 TO 8,500 (ROP 32' HR) WOB 10-17, MW 9.3, VIS 43, BG GAS

13, HOLE SEEPING 15 BBL HR
1/5/2008 06:00 -11:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 8,500 TO 8,603 (ROP 20.6) WOB 15-18, DHRPM 105, MW 9.25, VIS

41, BG GAS 15 UNITS- BIT SLOWWED DOWN TO 11' HR
11:00 - 11:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND SPOT 175 BBL.S OF 20% LCM IN HOLE FOR TRIP OUT

(COVERED OPEN HOLE)
11:30 - 12:00 0.50 SUR 1 DROPPED SURVEY
12:00 -18:00 6.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR NEW BIT TIGHT 8,523 TO 8,515, 6,406 TO 6,400, 6,321

TO 6,310
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 TRP 1 HANDLE BHA CHANGE OUT MOTOR AND BIT
19:00 -02:00 7.00 TRP 10 TEST MOTOR AND TRIP IN HOLE FILL@ BHA AND EVERY 3 ROWS AFTER
02:00 -03:30 1.50 REAM 1 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 8413 TO 8603 HAD 12' FILL
03:30 -06:00 2.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 8,603 TO 8,660 (ROP 22.8) WOB 5-10, DHRPM 115, MW 9.2, VIS 45

BG GAS 11 UNITS, RATTY DRILLING
1/6/2008 06:00 -14:00 8.00 DRL 1 DRILLING FROM 8,660 TO 8,801(ROP 17.6' HR) WOB 5-18, DHRPM 105-135, MW

9.2, VIS 42, BG GAS 15 UNITS, STARTED TO GETT NICKEL SIZED PIECES OF
SHALE A CROSSED SHAKERS BROUGHT MW TO 9.3+, HOLE ISN'T
SEEPING.WORKINGDIFFERNTPERAMETERS TO GET TO DRILL, OFF SETS
DRILLED QUICKER IN THIS SECTION

14:00 -14:30 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE TOP DRIVE AND BLOCKS
14:30 -06:00 15.50 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 8,801 TO 9150 (ROP 22.5' HR) WOB 5-18, DHRPM 120, MW 9.4,VIS

42, BG GAS 21UNITS, HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE NO SEEPAGE
1/7/2008 06:00 - 12:00 6.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 9150 TO 9277(ROP 21.2) WOB 15-20, DHRPM 127, MW 9.4+, VIS

42, BG GAS 25, NO HOLE SEEPAGE
12:00 -12:30 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG BLOCKS,SWIVEL, CROWN

Printed: 5/22/2008 10:43:25
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code CS
e Description of Operations

1/7/2008 12:30 -06:00 17.50 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 9277 TO 9690 (ROP 23.6) SAME PERAMETERS, MESA VERDE
CAME IN @9268, HAVE NO SEEPAGE, WT CREEPING UP WILL KICK ON
CENTER FUGES THIS AM, SINCE THERE ISN'T ANY LOSSES

1/8/2008 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 9,690 TO 9,849 (ROP 22.7 HR) WOB 15-20, DHRPM 125, MW
9.4+,VIS 43, BG GAS 24 UNITS,

13:00-14:00 1.00 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, TOP DRIVE, BLOCKS, TOOK OIL SAMPLES IN TOP DRIVE
14:00 -15:00 1.00 REAM 1 TIGHT CONNECTION WORKED THE STAND UP 25-35K OVER SLACK OFF

10-15K
15:00 -06:00 15.00 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 9849 TO 10,250 (ROP 26.T HR) WOB 15-20, DHRPM 125, MW 9.6,

VIS 42, BG GAS 50 UNITS, BRING MUD WT TO 9.6 AFTER TIGHT
CONNECTION, HELPED OUT ON CONNECTIONS

1/9/2008 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 10,250 TO 10,424 (ROP 24.8' HR) WOB 15-20, DHRPM 130, MW 9.7,
VIS 43, BG GAS 36, HOLE IN GOOD CONDITION

13:00-14:00 1.00 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, TOP DRIVE, CROWN
14:00 - 18:00 4.00 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 10,424 TO 10,619 (ROP 23.75)WOB 15-20, DHRPM 125, MW 9.7,

VIS 41, BG GAS 85,
18:00-18:30 0.50 RIG 2 REPAIR RIG SCR'S KlCKED OUT LOSS OF POWER TO DRILLER CONSOLE

(RESET PLC PANEL (COMPUTER IN SCR HOUSE) AND DRIVE GROUNDING
ROD

18:30 -06:00 11.50 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 10,519 TO 10,808 (ROP 25.7) SAME PERAMETERS, HAD SOME
GOOD GAS SHOWS @ 10,480

1/10/2008 06:00 -08:30 2.50 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 10,808 TO 10,835 (ROP 10.8) WOB 15-20, DHRPM 125, MW 9.7 BIT
QUIT DRILLING,(WORK PERAMETERS COULDN'T GET IT TO PICK UP OVER
15' HR)

08:30 -09:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND BUILDTRIP SLUG (THAW OUT TRIP TANK HOSE)
09:00-09:30 0.50 SUR 1 DROP SURVEY@10,801
09:30 - 15:00 5.50 TRP 10 PUMP TRIP SLUG AND TRIP OUT OF HOLE, HOLE WAS IN GREAT SHAPE NO

TIGHT SPOTS
15:00 -16:00 1.00 TRP 1 HANDLE BHA, LAYDOWN BIT AND MOTOR AND PICK UP BIT AND MOTOR .13

16:00 -17:30 1.50 TRP 10 TEST MOTOR TRIP IN HOLE FILL@ BHA
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG TOP DRIVE, DRAW-WORKS,BLOCKS
18:00 -20:30 2.50 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT #14 TO CASING SHOE (FILLING EVERY 200')
20:30 -22:00 1.50 RIG 6 CUT AND SLIP DRILLING LINE 90'
22:00 - 22:30 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG
22:30 -23:00 0.50 TRP 10 FILLPIPE AND TRIP IN HOLE, (DRILLING LINEWASN'T SPOOLING EVEN ON

DRUM)
23:00 -00:30 1.50 RIG 2 UNSPOOL LINE ON DRUM AND SPOOL LINE BACK ON DRUM (LINE WAS

LOOSE ON DRUM)
00:30 -03:30 3.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE -NO TIGHT SPOTS
03:30 -05:00 1.50 REAM 1 WASH AND REAM 140' TO BOTTOM (HAD 8' OF SOFT FILL)START PATTERN

ON BOTTOM WITH NEW BIT
05:00 -06:00 1.00 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 10, 835 TO 10,885 (ROP 50' HR)

1/11/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 10,885 TO 11,094 (ROP 20.9) WOB 5-15, DHRPM 120, MW 9.7, VIS
45, BGG 120 UNITS, NO LOSSES

16:00-16:30 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG (CHANGE OUT BREAKER IN PLC PANEL)
16:30 -06:00 13.50 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 11,094 TO 11,365 (ROP 20.0)WOB 10-20, DHRPM 120, MW 9.7, VIS

45, BGG 125 UNITS, NO LOSSES, WHEN DRILLING SLOWS DOWN-BEEN
PICKING UP 30' AND RESTARTING BIT

1/12/2008 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 11,365 TO 11,475 (ROP 20' HR) WOB 14, DHRPM 110, MW 9.7+,
VIS 46, BGG 275 UNITS, BRING MW UP SLOWLY TO 9.9

11:30-12:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG TOPDRIVE, SWIVEL, AND CHANGED OUT AIR VALVEON AIR
BRAKE HANDLE

12:00 -16:30 4.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 11,475 TO 11,570 (ROP 21.1' HR) WOB 18, DHRPM 118, MW 9.9,

Printed: Ñ2/200Š10:4Š:56
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

1/12/2008 12:00 - 16:30 4.50 DRL 1 VIS 46, BGG 384, PEAK GAS 4057 UNITS FROM 11,563" (HAD A LOT OF SLIP
STICK @ 11,493 TO 11,535 BACK WEIGHT TO 6K ON BIT STILL DRILLED 20'
HR)HAD BOP DRILLON DAYLIGHTS

16:30 - 17:30 1.00 REAM 1 WORK TIGHT CONNECTION FROM 11,570 TO 11,490 WAS BIT STUCK WHEN
BACKING ON CONNECTION AND BLEW A POP OFF, WORKED PIPE FREE AND
REAM BEFORE CONECTION TWICE (CLEANED UP)

17:30 -06:00 12.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 11,570 TO 11,690 TOP OF SEGO 11,591 (ROP 9.6' HR) WOB 18-22,
DHRPM 105-125, MW 10.4, VIS 42, BBG 141,CONNGAS2,300,

1/13/2008 06:00 -13:30 7.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 11,690 TO 11,742 (ROP 6.9) SLOWED TO 3 FT HOUR FOR A HOUR
MW 10.8, VIS 46, SHAKERS BY PASSED SEEPING 4-5 BBL.S HR, LCM 7% IN
ACTIVE, HOLE TOOK A DRINK @ 11,694 APROX. 32 BBL.S

13:30 -17:00 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP, AND MUD WT 10.7+ THRU ACTIVE, AND WEIGHT
UP 150 BBLMW 12.7, 20% LCM SLUG AND SPOT COVERED 2150 OF BOTTOM
OF OPEN HOLE

17:00 -20:30 3.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT (WET) OF HOLE SLOW, 35 STANDS ON TOP OF HEAVYSLUG
20:30 -22:30 2.00 CIRC 1 FLOW CHECK WELL FLOWING 1/2" STREAM-CIRCULATE @8386 BOTTOMS

UP FLARE ON BUSTER PEAK GAS 5778 UNIT'S 20' FLARE THEN WENT TO
FLICKER- CHECKED FLOW1/4" STREAM-SPOT 80 BBL OF 12.7 COVERING
1142' OF OPEN HOLE

22:30 -01:00 2.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT TO SHOE, CHECK FOR FLOW-NO FLOW PUMPED TRIP SLUG AND
PULL ROTATING HEAD

01:00 -05:00 4.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT TO CHANGE BIT AND MOTOR 2.4 BBL.S OVER FILL
05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 10 HANDLE BHA LAYDOWN MOTOR AND PICK UP NEW BIT AND MOTOR

1/14/2008 06:00 - 10:30 4.50 TRP 10 TRIP 600' TO 6992'
10:30 -11:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP 28 BBL GAIN, 2448 UNITS ON BUSTER

11:00 -13:00 2.00 TRP 10 TRIP TO 8892 AND CIR FOR 15 MIN/TRIP TO 107 (SLOW NOT TO KNOCK
BOTTOM OUT)

13:00 -14:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS @ THRU CHOKE UP 3/4" CHOKE, PEAK GAS 5605, 40'
FLARE, 75 BBL PIT GAIN (FUNTION PIPE RAMS AND ANNULAUR)

14:30 - 15:30 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN TO 11,567 (SLOW)
15:30 - 17:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP 4400 UNITS AND 77 BBL PIT GAIN, 3/4" CHOKE65'

FLARE
17:00 -18:00 1.00 REAM 1 WASH AND REAM FROM 11,567 TO 11,742 (8' SOFT FILL)
18:00 -06:00 12.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 11,742 TO 11,865 (ROP 10.3' HR) WOB 5-10, DHRPM 120, MW 11.2

VIS 45 (SHAKERS BY PASSED) 12% LCM-NO SEEPAGE
1/15/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 11,865 TO 11,954 (ROP 8.9' HR) WOB 6-16, MW 11.3, VIS 43, BGG

280 UNITS, 12% LCM
16:00-16:30 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, TOP DRIVE, BLOCKS, SWIVEL, (REPAIR POP OFF ON #1 PUMP)

POP OFF-WENT OFF ON CONNECTION
16:30 -06:00 13.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 11,954 TO 12,100 (ROP 10.8) WOB 10-20, MW 11.5, VIS 48, 13%

LCM BGG 25 UNITS-NO FLARE- NO SEEPAGE - RAISED MUD WT. DUE TO
POSSIBLE FUTURE GAS - MUD WT. = 11.5 AND ONLY SEEPING AT 2-3 BBLS
PER HOUR - WILL HEAL UP WHILE DRILLING

1/16/2008 06:00 -14:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 12,100 TO 12,240 (ROP 16.4' HR) WOB 15, MW 11.5, VIS 48, BGG
250 ON BUSTER, HAVE ALOT OF SLIP STICK

14:30 -15:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG SWlVEL, TOPDRIVE (FIXED SEAT fN #2 MUD PUMP)
15:00 -18:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 12,240 TO 12,270 (ROP 10' HR) RUNNING ALL DIFFERNT

PERAMETERS TO RID SLIP STICK
18:00 -06:00 12.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 12,270 TO 12,404 (11.2' HR) WOB 18 MW 11.5, VIS 48 LCM 12%

BGG 1980 OFF BUSTER, STILL HAVE SLIP STICK,
1/17/2008 06:00 -09:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILL Fl 12,404' TO 12,431' (2T @9 FPH ) WOB 15. MUD WT 11.6 PPG BGG
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Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

1/17/2008 06:00 - 09:00 3.00 DRL 1 UNITS STILL HAVE SLIP STICKING
09:00 -09:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
09:30 - 18:00 8.50 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 12,431' TO 12,575' ( 144' @ 17 FPH ) WOB 15 MUD WT 11.7 PPG VIS 42
18:00 -01:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL F/ 12,575' TO TD @ 12,675' ( 100' @ 14.2 FPH ) WOB 15 MUD WT 1.7 PPG

VIS 44
01:00 -03:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIR. & CONDITION HOLE FOR SHORT TRIP
03:00 -05:00 2.00 TRP 15 CONDITION TRIP ( TIGHT HOLE @ 11,588' TO 11,584) BACK REAM THROUGH

TIGHT SPOT & WORK STRING UNTIL HOLE CONDITION WAS GOOD
05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 15 TRIP BACK TO BOTTOM

1/18/2008 06:00 -07:00 1.00 TRP 14 FINISH WIPER TRIP ( W/ NO RESISTANCE )
07:00 -07:30 0.50 REAM i WASH & REAM F/ 12,590' TO TD @ 12,675' (8' FILL)
07:30 - 10:00 2.50 CIRC 1 CIR. & CONDITION HOLE ( SPOT HEAVY PILL ON BOTTOM )
10:00 - 17:30 7.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE ( STRAP ALL D.P. ) L/D MONEL & MOTOR BREAK OFF BIT
17:30 -19:00 1.50 LOG 1 RIG UP HAL.TO LOG
19:00 - 00:30 5.50 LOG 1 LOG 8 1/2" HOLE W/ TRIPLE COMBO W/ NO RESISTANCE & NO FILLON

BOTTOM TAG BOTTOM W/ LOGGING TOOLS @ 12,674' TD @ 12,675'
00:30 -01:30 1.00 LOG 1 RIG DOWN HAL. LOGGING EQUIPMENT
01:30 -06:00 4.50 TRP 2 M/UP 8 1/2" CONE BIT & BIT SUB W/ FLOAT TlH SLICK ( FILLUP PIPE EVERY

2500' )
1/19/2008 06:00 - 12:00 6.00 TRP 15 TIH ( FILL PIPE EVERY 2500') INSTALLROTATE HEAD RUBBER @10,120'

12:00 - 12:30 0.50 REAM i SAFETY WASH F/ 12,58T TO 12,675' W/ NO RESISTANCE
12:30 - 15:00 2.50 CIRC 1 CIR. & CONDITION HOLE & PUMP SPOT HEAVY PILL ON BOTTOM HOLD S/M

W/ ROCKY M. LAYDOWN CREW & R/UP LAYDOWN MACHINE
15:00 -03:00 12.00 TRP 5 TOH LAYING DOWN ALLTUBULARS & BHA.
03:00 -04:00 1.00 TRP 2 PULL WEAR BUSHING
04:00 -06:00 2.00 CSG 1 RIG UP T' CSG EQUIPMENT

1/20/2008 06:00 - 17:00 11.00 CSG 2 RUN T' CASING (29 # LTC P 110 ) SHOE, TWO JTS & F/C TOTAL OF 78 JTS #
29 P110 LT&C ONE MARKER JT. 200 JTS ( 26 # LT&C P-110 )& LANDJT.

17:00 -06:00 13.00 CIRC 1 CIR. & CONDITION HOLE & CUT MUD WT BACK TO 11.5 PPG DURING
CUTTING MUD WT TO 11.5 PPG LOST RETURNS ATT. TO RE-ESTABLISH
RETURNS NO SUCCESS
MUDVOL. GOT VERY LOW STOP CIR. TO BUILDMUD VOL CONTINUE TO
WORK STRING WITH NO OVERPULL OR DOWN DRAG AFTER GETTING MUD
VOL BUILT OBSERVE SLIGHT FLOW WITH OUT RUNNING MUD PUMPS
CHECK MUD WT COMING OUT 11.1 PPG OBSERVE FOR 30 MIN. FLOW
CONTINUE WITHOUT PUMPING SHUT IN WELL OBSERVE O PSI. OPEN WELL
FLOW CHECK WELL STATIC ATT. TO CIR. AFTER PUMPING25 TO 30 STKS
PRESSURE WOULD INCREASE BLEED OFF PSI ATT. TO CIR. & WORK
STRING WINO PROBLEMS AFTER ABOUT TWO HOURS WAS UNABLETO
WORK CASING STRING & STILL NO RETURNS

1/21/2008 06:00 -15:30 9.50 CSG 2 DRAIN BOPS LANDOFF CASING WITH CAMERON MAN. ATT. TO LANDOFF
ISOLATION CMT TOOL OBSERVE TOOL 8" HIGH PULL OUT OF HOLE & GRIND
DOWN THE BOTTOM SECTION OF BUSHING SPACER INSTALL& I.AND OFF
CMT TOOL SREW IN TIE DOWN BOLTS & P/TEST SEALS OK

15:30 -22:30 7.00 CMT 2 S/M & R/U HALPRESSURE TEST CEMENT LINES TO 6000 PSI P/T N2 LINES TO
8000 PSI PUMP SPACER 40 BBLS PUMP 1 LEAD CMT 125 BBLS PUMP 2ND
LEAD CEMENT 420 BBLS PUMP TAIL CMT 23.7 BBLS DROP TOP PLUG PUMP
DISP. 483.3 OBM BUMP PLUG @ 1250 PSI PRESSURE UP TO 2000 PSI W/ NO
FLOW BACKATT. TO CAP CMT PUMP TOTAL 3 BBLS W/ T15 PSI BLEED OFF
NO BACK FLOW

22:30 -00:00 1.50 CMT 1 R/D HAL CEMENT HEAD & LINES & POH & UD ISOLATION CMT TOOL W/ L JT.
00:00 -01:30 1.50 CMT 2 LAND DOWN ISOLATION CMT TOOL W/ L. JT.
01:30 -06:00 4.50 BOP 1 CHANGE OUT UPPER & LOWER PIPE RAMS TO 31/2" X 5" VARIABLE
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1/22/2008 06:00 -08:00 2.00 BOP 1 FINISH INSTALLING UPPER VAR. PIPE RAMS &TIGHT UP BOP RAMS DOORS
08:00 -15:00 7.00 BOP 1 REMOVE OLD LOW PRESSUE ROTATING HEAD & REPLACE Wl NEW HIGH

PRESSURE ROTATING HEAD &TRANSFER MUD FROM MUD TANKS & CLEAN
TANKS & LINES FOR OFLBASE MUD

15:00-21:00 6.00 RIG 2 INSTALLNEW EATON BREAK CONTROL VALVE@DRILLER CONSOLE &
REPLACE ALLAIR BREAK LINES Fl3/8" TO 1/2" & HYDRAULICBREAK LINES F/
CHINESE TO AMERICAN MADE HOSE & FITTING CONTINUE TO PREPARE
MUD TANKS & RIG FOR OIL BASE MUD

21:00 -00:00 3.00 OTH REMOVE RIG FLOOR PLATES & LOWER DRILLER SIDE BOP WINCH BEAM &
INSTALL DRIP PAN UNDER ROTARY TABLE FOR OIL BASE MUD

00:00 -01:30 1.50 BOP 2 P/TEST IBOP TOP DRIVE VALVEW/250 PSI LOW & 10000 PSI HIGH
01:30 -06:00 4.50 OTH M/UP TEST PLUG & ATT. TO LANDTEST PLUG IN WELL HEAD TEST PLUG

WOULD NOT PASS THROUGH LOWER PACK OFF ASSEMBLY ON HIGH
PRESSURE ROTATE HEAD ( CALLED SMITH ROTATE ENG. THEY WAS
UNABLE TO HELP OVER THE PHONE ) SMITH ENG. ARRIVED ON LOCATION
@0435 HRS, AGREED TO PULL OUT THE COMPLETE ROTATING HEAD
ASSEMBLY TO INSPECT & CHECK ( ID )

1/23/2008 06:00 -08:00 2.00 BOP 1 REMOVE SMITH ROTATE HEAD & LEAVE R. HEAD OUT FOR TESTING BOPS
08:00 -09:00 1.00 BOP 1 PULL WEAR BUSHING TO TEST BOPS
09:00 -14:00 5.00 BOP 2 P/TEST BOPS W/ 250 PSI LOW & 10.000 PSI HIGH P/TEST ANN. Wl250 PSI &

5000 PSI HIGH P/TCASING TO 1500 PSI -OK
14:00 - 15:00 1.00 OTH INSTALLWEAR BUSHING
15:00 -21:00 6.00 LOG 2 HOLD S/M R/UP HAL.& PICK UP CBL LOGGING TOOLS RIH W/ TOOLS TO

1050' LOGGING TOOL FAILED POH CHANGE OUT SENSOR ON TOOL RIH W/
TOOLS LOG HOLE FOUND TOP OF CEMENT @9,900' POH W/ LOGS & L/D
TOOLS R/D HAL.

21:00 - 01:30 4.50 OTH INSTALL DRIP PAN UNDER NEATH ROTARY FOR OIL BASE MUD & INSTALL
DRAIN HOSES TO CELLAR

01:30 - 06:00 4.50 TRP 1 PICK UP 6 1/8 BHA & NEW 4" XT-39 PIPE ( MAKE UP & BREAK OUT &
RE-TORQUE ) ALL CONNECTIONS INCLUDING BHA

1/24/2008 06:00 - 16:30 10.50 TRP 2 CONTINUE TO PICK UP 6 1/8 BHA & NEW DRILLPIPE
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
17:00 -18:00 1.00 TRP 2 TOH STAND 4" DRILL PIPE IN DERRICK TO BE USED TO DRILL6 1/8 HOLE &

PREPARE TO PICK4" DRILLPIPE, NUMBER & STRAP CONTINUE TO PICK UP
4" DRILL PIPE

18:00 -20:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP STAND 4" DRILL PIPE IN DERRICK
20:00 -21:00 1.00 TRP 2 STRAP DRILL PIPE ON RACK
21:00 - 22:00 1.00 RIG 2 CHANGE OUT HYDRAULIC HOSE ON CAT HEAD|22:00-02:00 4.00 TRP 2 PICK UP 4" DRILL PIPE
02:00-02:30 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE RACK BACK4"DRILL PIPE
02:30 -05:00 2.50 TRP 2 STRAP & PICK UP 4" DRILLPIPE
05:00 -06:00 1.00 OTH ATT. TO FILLUP PIPE MUD LINES FROZE UP THAW OUT MUD LINES TO RIG

FLOOR
1/25/2008 06:00 -09:00 3.00 OTH CONTINUE TO UNTHAW MUD LINES TO RIG FLOOR ATT. TO FILL PIPE

STRING PRESSURE UP TRY TO UNPLUGGED STRING WITH NO SUCCESS
09:00 -14:30 5.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT HOLE SLOW ( WET STRING )
14:30 -16:30 2.00 TRP 1 FOUND STEEL SHAVING @ FLOAT IN TOP OF MOTOR ALL PIPE WAS DRIFT

DURING PICKING UP PIPE L/D MOTOR & PICK UP NEW MOTOR
16:30 - 18:30 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLEW/ 6 1/8 ASSEMBLY &4" DRILLPIPE P/UP
18:30 -06:00 11.50 TRP 2 PICK UP 4" DRILL PIPE

1/26/2008 06:00 -08:00 2.00 TRP 2 CONTINUE TO PICK UP 4"XT-39 DRILLPIPE TO 12,540' BREAK CIR.
08:00 -09:00 1.00 LOC 4 RIG DOWN LAYDOWN MACHINE
09:00 -11:00 2.00 RIG 2 CHANGE OUT OIL IN TOP
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1/26/2008 11:00 -21:00 10.00 OTH CARRY OUT LOAD PATH INSPECTION ON COMPLETE TOP DRIVE W/ THIRD
PARTY COMMON SENSE INSPECTION COMPANY

21:00 -22:00 1.00 TRP 2 ATTEMPT TO INSTALLHIGH PRESSURE ROTATING HEAD HYDRAULIC
CLAMP NOT FUNCTIONING PROPERLY

22:00 -01:00 3.00 RIG 6 CUT & SLIP DRILLINGLINE
01:00 -06:00 5.00 OTH ATT.TO REPAIR HIGH PRESSURE ROTATING HEAD W/ NO SUCCESS PULL

ROTATE HEAD & REPLACE WITH OLD TYPE ROTATE HEAD
1/27/2008 06:00 -07:00 1.00 OTH CHANGED OUT SMITH HIGH PRESSURE ROTATING HEAD & BEARING

ASSEMBLY TO THE OLD TYPE ( MANUALCLAMP TYPE ) NOT HYDRAULIC
07:00 -09:00 2.00 DRL 4 DRILLSHOE TRACK EQUIPMENT
09:00 - 09:30 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLFl 12670' TO 12680' NEW HOLE
09:30 - 10:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIR. & CONDITION MUD
10:30 -12:30 2.00 OTH CONDUCT FIT TO 16 PPG EQUIVALENT
12:30 - 15:00 2.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 12,680' TO 12,730' DURING MAKINGMOUSEHOLE CONNECTION

WELL STARTED FLOWING SHUT IN WELL OBSERVE PRESSURE 50 PSI W/
8400 UNITS OF GAS PRESENT MUD WT 11.7 PPG

15:00 -21:00 6.00 WCL 1 CIR. OUT GAS KICK RAISE MUD WT TO 12.3 PPG FLOW CHECK WELL STATIC

21:00 - 06:00 9.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 12,730' TO 12,910' ( 180' @20' FPH ) WOB 12 - 16 MUD WT 13.0 PPG
VIS 48 BG GAS 275 UNITS W/ NO LOSSES

1/28/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 1 DRILLFl 12,910' TO 13,305' ( 395' @ 16.5' FPH ) WOB 18 - 20 K MUD WT 13.3
PPG VIS 46 BG 350 UNITS CONNECTION GAS 2550 UNITS W/ NO LOSSES &
NO HOLE PROBLEMS ( MANCOS B TOP @ 13052') PROJECTED TOP @ 12570'

1/29/2008 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 13,305' TO 13,402' MOTOR KEEP STALLING OUT ( 9T @ 13.8 FPH )
WOB 15-20K MUD WT 13.3 PPG VIS 45 NO LOSSES BG 685 UNITS
CONNECTION GAS 2850 UNITS

13:00 -16:00 3.00 CIRC 1 CIR. & CLEAN HOLE SPOT HEAVYPILL ON BOTTOM
16:00 - 17:30 1.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE W/ 6 1/8 ASSEMBLY TO 11,180'
17:30-18:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICERIG
18:00 - 23:30 5.50 TRP 2 CONTINUE TO TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO CHANGE OUT MOTOR & BIT
23:30 -00:30 1.00 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT MUD MOTOR & BIT
00:30 -02:00 1.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE BHA FILLPIPE & TEST MUD MOTOR OK
02:00 -06:00 4.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE & FILLPIPE EVERY 3000'

1/30/2008 06:00 - 06:30 0.50 RIG i RIG SERVICE & CHANGE OUT SAVER SUB
06:30 - 09:30 3.00 TRP 2 CONTINUE TO TRIP IN HOLE W/ 6 1/8 ASSEMBLY TO 13,20T
09:30 -10:00 0.50 REAM 1 SAFETY WASH & REAM FI 13,20T TO 13,402' W/ NO RESISTANCE
10:00 -18:00 8.00 DRL 1 DRILL FI 13,402' TO 13,690' (288' @36 FPH ) WOB 5 TO 8 MUD WT 13.4 VIS 46
18:00 -06:00 12.00 DRL 1 DRILLFl 13,690' TO 14,045' ( 355' @29.6 FPH ) WOB 6 TO 10 MUD WT 13.7 PPG

VIS 45 W/ NO LOSSES BG 955 UNITS CONNECTION GAS 3150 UNITS
1/31/2008 06:00 - 17:30 11.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 14,045 TO 14,354 (ROP 26.8' HR) WOB 7-10, DHRPM 90, BG GAS

800 UNITS, CON-GAS 3000 UNITS, MW 13.8, VIS 44,(RAISING WT SLOWLY
WITH BACK GROUND AND UP COMING GAS APROX @ 14,700

17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, TOP DRIVE, (WORK ON COMPENSATOR)
18:00 -06:00 12.00 DRL i DRILL FROM 14,354 TO 14,715 (ROP 30' HR) WOB 9-10, DHRPM 90, BG GAS

472UNITS, CON-GAS 1863, MW 14.5, VIS 50, EXPECTING GAS ANYTIME
(DAYLIGHTDRILLER SHORT 1 HAND)

2/1/2008 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 14,715 TO 14,831 (ROP 23.2' HR) WOB 8-10, DHRPM 90, MW 14.5,
VIS 49, BG GAS 800 UNITS, CONNECTION GAS 2800 UNITS, NO FLARE, GAIN
10 BBL.S

11:00 -11:30 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE, BLOCKS, SWIVEL,
11:30 -06:00 18.50 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 14,831 TO 15,440 (ROP 32.9' HR) WOB 8-10, DHRPM 90, MW 14.5,

VIS 49, BG GAS 1683, CONECTIONGAS 3000 (10' FLARE),EASING MW TO 14.7
2/2/2008 06:00 - 14:30 8.50 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 15,440 TO 15,689 (ROP 29.3'
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2/2/2008 14:30 -15:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG AND TOP DRIVE. SWIVEL, FIX HYDRALIC LEAKON BRAKE LINE
15:00 -18:30 3.50 DRL 1 DRILL DROM 15,689 TO 15,790 (ROP 28.9' HR)
18:30 -20:30 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE GAS OUT OF WELL APROX.80 BBL GAIN, FLARE 6', SPLASHING

OUT POSSUM BELLYWITH GAS, SHUT IN AND TRIED TO CHOKE OUT WITH
OUT MAKINGMESS , 1460 PSI CASING PRESSURE BRING MUD WEIGHT
UP-LOST 260 BBLS.

20:30 -06:00 9.50 DRL 1 DRILLTHROUGH CHOKE FROM 15,790 TO 16,045 (ROP26.8' HR) BOTTOMS
UP GAS HAS A GOOD PUSH TO IT GAIN 30 BBL. SURGING AT POSSUM
BELLY/SPLASHING MUD 5'-T INTO AIR MUD WT 15.3 IN AND 15.0 OUT -HAVE
HAD A GREAT SHOW @ 15,739

2/3/2008 06:00 -06:30 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLTHROUGH CHOKE FROM 16,045 TO 16,072 (ROP 54' HR) WOB 10,
DHRPM 90, MW 15.3, START LOSSING CIRCULATION WITH ANYTHINGOVER
15.3-

06:30-09:00 2.50 CIRC 1 STARTED TO LOSS CIRCULATION 20 BBL HR. BEFORE CONNECTION BUILT
LCM SWEEP 10%.

09:00 - 13:30 4.50 DRL 1 DRILLTHROUGH CHOKE FROM 16,072 TO 16,170 (ROP 21.T HR) WOB 10,
DHRPM 90, MW 15.2+,ON CONNECTION BOTTOMS UP HAVE SOME MAJOR
GAS CONNECTION FLARE 25'. GAS 5019 UNITS,

13:30 -14:30 1.00 OTH ON CONNECTION FLOAT WOULDN'T HOLD FLOWING BACK, HAD480 PSI ON
BACK SIDE, CIRULATED A BOTTOMS UP AND SLAP FLOAT TO SEE IF IT
WOULD WORK (NO GO)

14:30-18:00 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE MUD INTO SHAPE 15.3 MW (HAD SOME LIGHT SPOTS) AND
BUILD ECD PILLAND TRIP SLUG (SHORT HANDED TWO HANDS AND HANDS
WE ARE TRYlNG)

18:00 - 18:30 0.50 CIRC 1 SPOT ECD SLUG (17.5 PPG COVERED 2500 FT OF OPEN HOLE)
18:30 -02:30 8.00 TRP 13 TRIP FOR FLOAT FAILURE, COULDN'T MAKE CONNECTION, BECAUSE OF

PRESSURE ON BACK SIDE
02:30 -03:30 1.00 TRP 1 LAYDOWN AND PICK UP MUD MOTOR AND BIT (404Z+)(FUNCTION TEST

BLIND RAMS AND PIPES)
03:30 -05:00 1.50 TRP 13 TRIP IN HOLE WITH NEW MOTOR AND BIT (SURFACE TEST MOTOR)--BHA
05:00 -06:00 1.00 OTH PICKING UP 15 JOINT OF DRILLPIPE TO HAVE ENOUGH TO TD WELL HAVING

TO MAKE AND BREAK PIPE (NEW PIPE)
2/4/2008 06:00 -11:00 5.00 TRP 13 PICK UP 15 JOINT'S OF DRILLPIPE(TO HAVE ENOUGH TO TD WELL-MAKE

AND BREAK NEW PIPE, TRIP IN HOLE FILL PIPE EVERY 4000 FT
11:00 -12:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP AT SHOE/ 3/8 CHOKE 40 FLARE, PEAK GAS UNITS

7696, 416 ON CASING
12:30 -13:30 1.00 TRP 13 TRIP IN HOLE 14,200 AND BREAK CIRCULATION TO GET HALF 175 MUD INTO

CASING
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE HEAVYMUD INTO CASING
14:00 - 15:00 1.00 TRP 13 TRIP INTO 15,896 TAG BRIDGE
15:00 -17:00 2.00 REAM i WASH AND REAM FROM 15896 TO 16,170, HAD TO SHUT IN TO CIRCULATE

GAS OUT WHEN BOTTOMS UP CAME, ON 3/8 CHOKE, 70' FLARE (5-7
MINUTES OF DRY GAS-NO RETURNS) 1092 CASING PRESSURE GAS UNITS
PEAK 5503

17:00 -06:00 13.00 DRL 1 DRILL THRU CHOKE FROM 16,170 TO 16,505 (ROP 25.8' HR) WOB 5-8, ROT 81,
ON CONNECTION MW15.3 VIS 54, DRILLWITH T FLARE,CONNECTION GAS
FLARE 2540 CASING 260 1/2 CHOKE (REAL GASSY) (DAKOTA PROG. 16778)

2/5/2008 06:00 - 18:30 12.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 16,505 TO 16,834 (ROP 26.32' HR)WOB 5-10, DHRPM 75, MW 15.3,
VIS 48, BG 2500 UNITS

18:30 - 19:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG, TOP DRIVE, SWlVEL
19:00 -05:00 10.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 16,834 TO 16,932(ROP 8.9' HR} (DAKOTA SILT @ 16,798) WOB

5-15, DHRPM 55-105, MW 15.3, VIS 48, BG 2500 UNITS
05:00 -06:00 1.00 SUR 1 DROP SURVEY AND CIRCULATE BOTTOMS
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2/6/2008 06:00 -08:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC. BTMS UP & SPOT 150 BBL 17.5 ECD SLUG 395T OF OPEN HOLE
08:30 -16:30 8.00 TRP 10 TOOH TO SHOE @ 12646' (SHOE) CHECK FOR FLOW PUMP DRY SLUG FINISH

TOOH

16:30 - 17:30 1.00 TRP 1 HANDLE BHA L/D MOTOR, XO AND P/U BIT SUB, BREAK AND MAKE NEW BIT
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE RIG T/D, DRAW WORKS
18:00 -01:00 7.00 TRP 10 TIH W/ BIT#19 FILL@
01:00-03:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC B/U @SHOE 3500 STKS NO PIT GAIN OR FLARE
03:00 -05:30 2.50 RIG 6 CUT & SLIP 130' OF DRILL LINE
05:30 -06:00 0.50 TRP 10 CONT TIH-SLOW

2/7/2008 06:00 -07:00 1.00 TRP 10 TIH TO 14622'
07:00 -07:30 0.50 TRP 10 FILLPIPE & CIRC. 1000 STKS
07:30 -08:30 1.00 TRP 10 TlH TO 16812'
08:30 -09:00 0.50 REAM 1 SAFETY WASH & REAM F/16812' TO 16932' (NO HOLE FILL)
09:00 -09:30 0.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 16932' TO 1693T (ROP 10' HR) LOSING MUD TOTAL OF 160 BBL.S

LOST
09:30 - 12:00 2.50 CIRC 2 MIXLCM& SPOT LCM PILL ON BTM.
12:00 -12:30 0.50 TRP 15 TOOH TO 16609', SI WELL DUE TO FLOW
12:30 -14:30 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRC OUT GAS REGAIN 90% RETURNS
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE AND WASH LAST STAND DOWN,
15:00 -06:00 15.00 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 16,932 TO 16,994 (ROP 4.1' HR )

2/8/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 16994' TO 16998' (4' 2.6 AVG ROP)
07:30 -09:00 1.50 CIRC 1 SPOT 160 BBLS. OF 15% LCM, 17.5 PPG OBM
09:00 - 16:30 7.50 TRP 10 TOOH W/ BIT#19
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 TRP 10 HANDLE BHA& B/O BIT
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE, BLOCKS, SWlVEL, TOP DRIVE
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 TRP 10 M/U BIT #20 & TIH W/ BHA FILL@3630, 8855, 12600, 14,673
18:00 -21:30 3.50 TRP 10 TIH BHAAND DP TO 3630
21:30 - 22:00 0.50 RIG 2 REPAIR TOP DRIVE DIE KEEPER
22:00 -00:00 2.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE AND INSTALL ROTATING HEAD @SHOE
00:00 -01:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIR CULATE BOTTOMS UP @ SHOE
01:00 -02:00 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE 20 STANDS SLOW TO 14,673
02:00 -03:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP- STAGE UP PUMP, TRY NOT TO KNOCK BOTTOMS

OUT OF HOLE, GET HEAVYMUD OUT OF HOLE -HAD 35' FLARE
03:30 - 05:00 1.50 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE SLOW TO 16,905 (HOLE WAS CLEAN)
05:00 -06:00 1.00 REAM 1 WASH AND REAM Fl16,905 TO 16,998 WHILE CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP,

STAGE UP PUMP
2/9/2008 06:00 -07:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CONT TO CIRC OUT BTMS UP 28 BBL GAIN Wl50' FLARE

07:00 - 18:00 11.00 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 16998' TO 17038' (ROP 3.6' HR) WOB 6-7, DH RPM 65-75 MW 15.1 VIS.
48 BGG 595 NO FLARE

18:00 - 21:00 3.00 DRL 1 DRILLFl 17038' TO 17052' (ROP 4.6 HR) WOB 7-9, RPM 65 75 MW 15.1 VIS 48
BGG 55 NO FLARE PARTIAL FLUID LOSS @ 17045'-17051'108 BBLS

21:00 -21:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVCE ATTEMPT TO REPAIR D/W BRAKE LINE
21:30 - 06:00 8.50 DRL 1 DRILLF/ 17052' TO 17086' (ROP 4' HR) WOB 7-9, DH RPM 65-75, MW 15.1, VIS

47 BGG 102 NO FLARE
2/10/2008 06:00 -23:00 17.00 DRL 1 DRILLFROM 17,086' TO 17152' (ROP 3.8 FT/HR) WOB 9K DH RPM 70 MW 15.1

VIS 49 BG 200 NO FLARE
23:00 -00:00 1.00 FISH 6 WORK STUCK PIPE @ 17152' SLACK OFF 50 K DOWN, PULLED OUT FREE W/

85K OVER @305K
00:00 -02:30 2.50 CIRC 1 CIRC & BUILDECD SLUG TO 17.5 PPG 180 BBLS & SPOT SAME.
02:30 -05:00 2.50 TRP 10 TOH Fl 17152' TO 12464' (SHOE) CHECK FOR FLOW , PULL ROTATE HEAD
05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 10 CONT TO TOH

2/11/2008 06:00 - 10:00 4.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE

Printed: 5/22/2008 10:43:25
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

2/11/2008 10:00-11:00 1.00 TRP 10 BREAK BIT AND BIT SUB AND CHANGE OUT FLOATS (CLEAN RIG FLOOR)AND
MAKE UP NEW BIT (BIT MISSING 2 RETAINERS AND ONE JET)

11:00 -17:00 6.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE WITH NEW BIT, FILL@3975, 9200, 12660 (SHOE)
17:00-18:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @SHOE 40' FLARE ON FLOW LINE BUSTER
18:00 - 19:00 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 14, 604 (SLOW)
19:00 - 20:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP 20' FLARE
20:00 - 21:00 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 16,050 (SLOW)
21:00 -21:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE 1500 STROKE TO GET SWEEP INTO CASING
21:30 -22:30 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 16,960 (SLOW)
22:30-00:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP, 25 BBL GAIN, 35' FLARE AND 117 PSI ON CASING
00:00 -01:00 1.00 REAM i WASH AND REAM FROM 16,960 TO 17,152-HAD 8'OF HARD REAMING
01:00 -06:00 5.00 DRL 1 |DRILL FROM 17,152 TO 17165' (ROP 2.6' HR) WOB 4-10, DHRPM 70, MW- 15.0,

VIS-48, WORKING ALL DIFFERNT PERAMETERS TO GET TO DRILL
2/12/2008 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 17,165 TO 17,177 (2.4' HR) WOB 8-14 DH RPM 45-70 MW 15.0 VIS

48
11:30-12:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND SPOT ECD SLUG (17.5--170 BBL.S) COVER OPEN HOLE
12:30 - 19:00 6.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE WITH BIT #21 DSX711
19:00 -20:00 1.00 TRP 1 CHANGE BIT AND FLOAT IN BIT SUB-(ALOT OF MARKINGS ON THE SIDE OF

MONEL WHERE JUNK HAS BEEN BESIDE IT)
20:00 -01:00 5.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE FILLPIPE @4906', 10168'
01:00 -02:00 1.00 RIG 6 CUT & SLIP DRILLLINE
02:00 -03:30 1.50 CfRC 1 CIRC BTMS UP @ 12,606 (SHOE) 1813 UNITS NO FLARE
03:30 - 04:30 1.00 TRP 10 TIH TO 14896'
04:30 -06:00 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP @ 14896 4000 UNITS 35' FLARE

2/13/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE TO 17,090
07:30 -08:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE HEAVYSLUG OUT OF HOLE
08:30 -09:00 0.50 REAM 1 SAFETY WASH AND REAM FROM 17,090 TO 17,177 (TORQUE WHEN ABOUT 3'

OFF BOTTOM)
09:00 -09:30 0.50 OTH FAN BOTTOM WITH 1-3 ON BIT AND WORK BIT WEIGHT UP SLOW
09:30 -18:00 8.50 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 17,177 TO 17,209 (ROP 3.T HR) WOB 23, RPM 60-75, MW 15.1, VIS

46, BG GAS 2400 UNITS
18:00 -01:00 7.00 DRL 1 DRILL FROM 17,209 TO 17,227 OFF BOTTOM TQ 1500'#, ON 2000-2800'# (ROP

2.6' HR) WORK DIFFERNT PERAMETERS (LOST PARTIAL RETURNS 50 BBL
RIGHT A WAY) THEN SEEPED 180 BBL.S ALLTOGETHER - TRIED TO GET BIT
TO DRILL, STARTED TO GET MORE TORQUE THAN BEFORE-DECIDED TO
PULL (BECAUSE OF DRILLINGJUNK)

01:00 -02:00 1.00 REAM i BREAK OFF DOUBLE AND BACK REAM FROM 17,186 TO 17,171 55K OVER
PULL-ALSO STALLING OUT TOP DRIVE, JUNK ALONG SIDE DRILL STRING

02:00 -05:00 3.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE WHILE BUILDING SLUG TO TRIP, AND SPOT 175 BBL. 17.5 SLUG
IN OPEN HOLE

05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 10 TOOH FI 17215' TO 16,000
2/14/2008 06:00 -12:00 6.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUTOF HOLE Fl 15,348'& STAND BHA INDERRICK BREAK OUT BiT

12:00 - 13:00 1.00 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
13:00 - 22:30 9.50 LOG 1 SAFETY MEETING & R/UP HAL. LOGGING EQUIPMENT LOG OPEN HOLE RUN

# 1 GRAMMAR& SONIC RUN TO BOTTOM WI NO HOLE PROBLEMS. LOGGED
FI 17212'- 12646' LOGGERS TD @17238'. RAN SPECTRAL DENSITY DUAL
SPACED NEUTRON F/ 17235'-12646', RIG DOWN LOGGERS

22:30 -23:00 0.50 LOG 4 CHANGED OUT ROTATING HEAD FOR WlRELINE AND INSTALLED DRILLING
ROTATING HEAD.

23:00-03:00 4.00 TRP 15 MAKE UP NEW BIT, RE DRESS FLOAT ASSEMBLY AND INSTALLCROWS
FOOT, TlH. SLM. ATT. TO BREAK CIR. @2985' STRING PLUGGED

03:00 -06:00 3.00 TRP 2 PULL OUT OF HOLE DUE TO PLUGGED STRING
2/15/2008 06:00 - 08:00 2.00 TRP 2 PULL OUT OF HOLE DUE TO PLUGGED
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

2/15/2008 08:00 - 14:00 6.00 TRP 2 FOUND LCM PLUGGED OFF CROW FOOT & FLOAT CLEAN FLOAT &
REDRESS FLOAT M/UP SAME RIH BHA BREAK CIR. FILLPIPE EVERY 300'
SLM IN HOLE

14:00 - 16:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIR. OUT GAS @ CASING SHOE 2,915 UNITS OF GAS
16:00 - 17:00 1.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE TO 15,008'
17:00 -19:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIR. OUT GAS TOTAL 2,855 UNITS
19:00 -20:30 1.50 TRP 15 TRIP IN HOLE TO 17106'
20:30 - 01:00 4.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM F/ 17106'-1722T SLM WAS 17227.4
01:00-04:30 3.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE & SPOT 175 BBLS OF 17.5 PPG IN OPEN

HOLE
04:30 -06:00 1.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUTOF HOLE TO SHOE & PREPARE TO LAYDN PIPE

2/16/2008 06:00 -08:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT TO CASING SHOE
08:00 -09:00 1.00 TRP 3 RIG UP LAYDOWN MACHINE
09:00 - 17:00 8.00 TRP 3 LAYDOWN DRILLPIPE TO BHA
17:00 -18:00 1.00 TRP 2 RUN IN HOLE W/ DRILLPIPE FROM DERRICK
18:00-00:00 6.00 TRP 3 LAYDOWN DRILLPIPE & BHA
00:00-00:30 0.50 TRP 2 PULL HIGH PRESSURE BEAR ASSEMBLY
00:30-01:30 1.00 TRP 2 PULL WEAR BUSHING
01:30 -04:00 2.50 CSG 1 R/UP ROCKY MOUNTAIN CASING CREW TO RUN 4.5 CASING
04:00 - 06:00 2.00 CSG 2 S/M & M/UP SHOE & FLOAT COLLAR & PICK UP 4.5 CASING JTS.

2/17/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 CSG 2 CHANGE OUT FILLUP TOOL
07:30 - 17:00 9.50 CSG 2 PICK UP 4.5 CASING TO SHOE
17:00 -19:00 2.00 CIRC 1 CIR. OUT GAS @CASING SHOE
19:00 - 01:00 6.00 CSG 2 CONTINUE TO PICK UP 4.5 CASING
01:00 -05:30 4.50 CIRC 1 CIR. & CONDITION MUD REDUCE MUD WT TO 14.9 PPG & R/D CASING

EQUIPMENT
05:30 -06:00 0.50 CSG 1 RIG DOWN FILLUP TOOL & R/UP HAL. CEMENT HEAD

2/18/2008 06:00 -10:30 4.50 CMT 2 CIR. CASING & WAIT ON HAL.TO REPAIR CMT. PUMP TRUCK
10:30 -16:00 5.50 CMT 2 R/UP P/TEST LINES TO 12000 PSI PUMP 20 BBLS WT SPACER IIIPUMP 760

SKS 15.3LBIGAL PRIMARY CEMENT TOC @5000' WASHUP PUMPS & LINES
TO PIT DROP TOP PLUG PUMP 10 BBLS CLAYFIXIIWATER W/ 1 GAL MMCR 3
BPM PUMP246.6 BBLS CLAY FIXWATER @3 BPM Wl7300 PSI CIR. RATE
BUMP PLUG & P/TEST W/ 8300 PSI HOLD 15-MIN OK BLEED OFF PSI FLOAT
OK

16:00 - 18:30 2.50 BOP i HOLD S/MEETING W/ B&C QUICK TEST & RIG UP BOPS LIFTS
18:30 - 21:00 | 2.50 BOP 1 REMOVE DRIP PAN BELOW ROTARY TABLE & NIPPLE DOWN BOPS TO SET

CASING SLIPS
21:00 -23:30 2.50 BOP 1 LIFT STACK & SET SLIPS ( SLIPS SET @ 195 K STRING WT. )
23:30 -01:00 1.50 BOP 1 RIDN B & C QUICK TEST
01:00 -06:00 5.00 LOC 7 CLEAN MUDTANKS & RIG FLOOR PREPARE TO LAYDN TOP DRIVE

2/19/2008 06:00 -06:00 24.00 LOC 7 CONTINUE TO CLEAN MUD TANKS , FINISH RIGGING DOWN TOP DRIVE,
REMOVE WIND WALLS & LAYDOWN TORQUE TUBE, BROKE MUD LINE
SUITCASE AND REMOVE VIBRATING HOSES BETWEEN PUMP HOUSE &
SUBBASE, UNWIRE WIRE LINE FROM DERRICK & R/D BREAK CONNECTIONS
ON STAND PIPE

06:00 - ON NEW LOCATION WELL NEW WELL AHEAD ARRIVED ON LOCATION @
1400 HRS, REMOVE SNOW & ICE FROM CELLAR & PREPARE TO INSTALL
WELL HEAD SHOULD BE ABLE TO FINISH INSTALLINGWELL AHEAD BY
NOON TODAY. MOVE 8 LOADS OF DRILL PIPE, HWDP & DRILLCOLLARS

2/20/2008 06:00-10:00 4.00 LOC 8 FINSIH CLEANING MUD TANKS & GAS BUSTER BRIDLE UP REMOVE SADDLE
FROM SRVICE LOOP ON TOP DRIVE ( RIG RELEASED @ 1000 HRS ON
2/19/2008 }

10:00 -06:00 20.00 LOC 8 RIG DOWN & MOVE BAR TANKS/MUD CLEANER/CENTERFUGES AND SHUT
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:RW 34-34AD Spud Date: 11/22/2007
Location: 34- 7-S 22-E 26 Rig Release: 2/19/2008
Rig Name: UNIT Rig Number: 328

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

2/20/2008 10:00 -06:00 20.00 LOC 8 BIOLER LAYDN AIR TUGGERS FROM RIG FLOORI LAYDERRICK OVER
UNSPOOL DRILL LINE BLOW DOWN BOILER & RIG DOWN DRIVE LINES

rk& Wib08 10:43:25



State of Utah OPERATORACCT. No. N-5085

Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: Questar Exploration & Production, Co.
ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South

ENTITY ACTION FORM - FORM6 Vernal, Utah 84078-8526 (435)781··4342

Action Current New Entity API Number Well Name QQ SC TP RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No.

No.
16177 16177 43-047--36351 RW 34-34 AD SWSE 34 7S 22E Uintah 6/7/07 3/25/08

WELL 1 CO/IWME : MFD 4 OS M/

WELL2 COMMENTS:

WELL3 COMMENTS:

WELL 4 COMMENTS:

WELL 5 COMMENTS:

ACTION CODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entity for newwell (singlewell only)
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) .

9 I AA

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity Signature
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section) Office Administrator11 6/17/08

NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected
Title Date

Phone No. (435)781-4342

(3/89)

\L



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Tm Mms'
Utah State Office 'NAM ERICA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
(U-922)

June 25, 2008

QuestarExploration and Production Co.
Independence Plaza
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265
Attn: Chad W. Matney

Re: Non-Paying Well Determination
RW 34-34AD
Red Wash Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to your request of June 9, 2008, it has been determined by this office that under existing
conditions the following well is not capable of producing unitized substances in paying
quantities as defined in Section 9 of the unit agreement.

API Number Well Name Location Comp. Date Lease

4304736351 RW34-34AD SW¼SE¼ 34 7.0 S 22.0 E SLB&M 03/25/2008 UTUO558

m this well shall be handled and reported on a lease basis.

Sincerely,

/s/ Becky J. Hammond

Becky J. Hammond
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals



bec: FOM Vernal
Red Wash Unit File
MMS
SITLA
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron.
Fluid Chron
Tickler (August, 2008)



State of Utah OPERATOR ACCT. No. N-5085
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: Questar Exploration & Production, Co.

ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South
ENTITYACTION FORM - FORM6 Vernal, Utah 84078-8526 (435)781-4342

ActÏoi Current New Entity API NumbeÝ Well Name QQ SC TP RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No.

No.
E 16177 16177 43-047-36351 RW 34-34 AD SWSE 34 7S 22E Uintah 6/7/07 3/1/09

WELL 1 COMMENTS: WMMFD

WELL 2 COMMENTS:

WELL 3 COMMENTS:

WELL 4 COMMENTS:

WELL5 COMMENTS:

ACTIONCODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entityfor newwell (single well only) I
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell)
C - Re-assign well from one existingentity to another existing entity Signature
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section) OfficeAdministrator 4/10/09

Title Date
NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected

Phone No. (435)781-4342
(3/89)

RECE1VED CONRDEN¶ALAPR\ 3 2003
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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rm o UNITED STATES oOM

-

3D7
ug DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires: July 31, 2010

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
UTU-0558

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. N/A

SUB&lIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on page 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
RED WASH UNIT

l. Type of Well

O oilweli O Gas Well O Other 8. Well Name and NRW
34-34AD

2. Name of Ooerator 9. API Well No.
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. CONTACT: Mike Stahl 43-047-36351

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UTAH 84078

(303) 308-3613 UNDESIGNATED

4. LocatAnof Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M, or Survey Description) 11. Country or Parish, State
858' FSL 1944' FEL, SWSE, SECTION 34, T7S, R22E UINTAH, UTAH

12. CHECK THE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon COMMINGLING

Final Abandonment Notice O Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation: Clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof If
the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports must be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 must be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

In Compliance with the Administrative Utah code for drillling and operating practice R649-3-22, completion into two or more pools. Questar Exploration &
Production Company hereby requests the commingling of production between intervals in the RW 34-34AD. Questar considers this commingling to
be in the public interest in that it promotes maximum ultimate economic recevery, prevents waste, provides fororderly and efficient production of oil and
gas and presents no detrimental effects from commingling the gas streams.

Questar requests approval for the commingling of production of the Dakota to the Wasatch intervals. Based upon offset production logs, the proposed initial
allocation is as follows: Dakota - 20%; Mancos - 40%; mesa Verde - 30%; Wasatch - 10%.

On an annual basis the gas will be sampled and a determination will be made of the BTU content and gas constituents. These annual samples can be
used to determine if the gas allocation is changing over time. Ifthese samples do not indicate that any adjustments in allocation are necessary they
may be discontinues after the fifth anniversary of the initial production.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. Name (Printed/Typed)

SiLgatrueBil Title Asso0ciate0Regulatory Affairs Analyst

Approved by

SPACE FOR FEDERAL TORS T OF E USE

Date
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or certify
that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would Office ÓM OGESÍAppf0valOfThis
entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. R EIVED ActionisNecessary
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false,
fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page 2)

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&



AFFIDAVIT OF NOTICE

STATE OF COLORADO )
) ss:

COUNTY OF DENVER )

Nathan C. Koeniger, being duly sworn, deposes and says:

1. That I am employed by QuestarExploration and Production Company in the
capacity as a Landman. My business address is:

Independence Plaza
1050 17* Street, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265

2. In my capacity as a Landman, pursuant to the provisions of Utah
Administrative Rule 649-3-22, I have provided a copy of QuestarExploration
and Production Company's application for completion of the RW 34-34 AD
well into two or more pools, in the form of Utah Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining's Form 9 Sundry Notice, to owners of all contiguous oil and gas leases
or drilling units overlying the pools which are the subject of that application.

3. In my capacity as a Landman, I am authorized to provide such notice of
QuestarExploration and Production Company's application to contiguous
owners and to make this affidavit on this j3¾ day of 'l
2009.

Printed Name: Nathan C. Koeniger

The foregoing instrument was sworn to and subscribed before me this \ S day of
\ 2009, by Nathan C. Koeniger.

THEIŒSACHATMAN
-NOTARYPUBLIC-

Notary Public

W • s • EXPIRES•] I (

STATEOF
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit: RED WASH
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Energy (Red Wash) FORMA.xls



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

See attached
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See attached
T UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° See attacheddrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for suchproposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL
8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL Ü GAS WELL OTHER See attached

2 NAeMEOFO

XPOr tionand Production Company Att che
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver CO z 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See attached COUNTY: Attached

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(SutamitOriginal Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Operator Name

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change
12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pemnent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This name
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The same
employees will continue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. All operations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965666083
Fee Land Bond Number: 303ûù3üü3
BfA Bond Number: TGG446- WP

$~O/o to 13
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As of
June 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described onthe list

NAME(PLEASE P Morgan Anderson
TITLE Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATU DATE 6/23/2010

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED APPROVEDÁ/2/ AN9
JUN2 8 2010

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
ÛÎVÎSÎOn of Oil,GasandMining'DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING EarleneRussell, Engineering



Questar ExplorationProduction Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH

eñ=ectiveJune 14,2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

FER/34-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715136 5670 Federal (TOT P
RTV41-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715138 5670 Federal ONV P
RW 32-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715139 5670 Federal OW P
RW 43-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715140 5670 Federal OW P
RW 32-17C 17 070S 240E 4304715145 5670 Federal OW P
RW 34-26B __ 26 070S 230E 4304715148 5670 Federal GW TA
10%732-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715150 5670 Federed (IRT PIUgr34-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715152 5670 Federed CA¥ S
RW 23-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715153 5670 Federal OW TAICRT43-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715155 5670 Federal ()VV PFCyr32-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715156 5670 Federal Cfür P
R3W23-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715157 5670 Federal GVV Tzt
Flu'34-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715158 5670 Federal ()VV P
IUMT32-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715163 5670 Federed GNV P
RTVl4-23B 23 070S 230E 4304715165 5670 Federal ONV S
RW 14-24A 24 070S 220E 4304715166 17554 Federal OW DRL
IUn'21-24B 24 070S 230E 4304715167 5670 Federed CA¥ TA
RMr34-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715168 5670 Federed ONV P
ICRT21-29C 29 070S 240E 4304715169 5670 Federed GVV P
RW 12-17B 17 070S 230E 4304715170 5670 Federal OW P
RTV32-33C 33 070S 240E 4304715171 5670 Federed GNV P
RNV14-23A 23 070S 220E 4304715176 5670 Federed ONV P
ItWV12-18C 18 070S 240E 4304715183 5670 Federal ()TV P
RMT21-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715186 5670 Federed (ini TA
RMT34-18B 18 070S 230E 4304715189 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 21-27B __ 27 070S 230E 4304715 56 0 _Federal OW TA
FUN23-22/t 22 070S 220E 4304715192 5670 Federal O3W P
RW 21-18C 18 070S 240E 4304715193 5670 Federal OW P
REV12-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715196 5670 Fedend GrlV S
R3¥32-18C 18 070S 240E 4304715198 5670 Federal (iYV P
RIVU77(21-13B) 13 070S 230E 4304715199 5670 Federed ONV P
RNV32-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715200 5670 Federal ONV P
RTV12-27B 27 070S 230E 4304715201 5670 Fedend ONV T'A
RMT14-27B 27 070S 230E 4304715202 5670 Federed CTMT P
FDV41-31B 31 070S 230E 4304715203 5670 Federal ()VV P
RMT41-27A 27 070S 220E 4304715205 5670 Federed ONV S
RMT44-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715206 5670 Federed GBW P
R3¥43-21B 21 070S 230E 4304715211 5670 Federal ()?V P
RTV12-22A 22 070S 220E 4304715213 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 12-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715218 5670 Federal OW P
Flüf34-21B 21 070S 230E 4304715220 5670 Federal ()VV P
RMT34-15B 15 070S 230E 4304715222 5670 Fedend (TR' P
RW 32-21B 21 070S 230E 4304715226 5670 Federal OW P
90W21-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715227 5670 Federal (39V P

Bonds:BLAñ=ESBOOOO24
BIA=956010693

State= 965010695 1 of



Questar ExplorationProduction Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH

efectiveJune 14,2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
leaseRTV23-23A 23 070S 220E 4304715228 5670 Fedend ONV P

RTV32-24A 24 070S 220E 4304715229 5670 Federal ONV P
RTV32-28/t 28 070S 220E 4304715230 5670 Federal ()TV SRV(21-19B 19 070S 230E 4304715233 5670 Fedend ONV Pfin'43-29A 29 070S 220E 4304715236 5670 Fedend CnW S C
RW 23-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715237 17525 Federal OW P CRTVl3-13B 13 070S 230E 4304715238 5670 Federed Gr1V PRyr24-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715239 5670 Federed ONV Pftw/41-29A 29 070S 220E 4304715243 5670 Federed OGV P
RTV14-15B 15 070S 230E 4304715246 5670 Federed 05V P
10%741-34B 34 070S 230E 4304715250 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 41-30B 30 070S 230E 4304715254 5670 Federal OW P
RW 24-22B 22 070S 230E 4304715255 5670 Federal OW P
RTV33-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715257 5670 Federed ONV PECui21-18B 18 070S 230E 4304715258 5670 Federal OVV 134
RW 22-22B_ _ 22 070S 230E 4304715260 5670 Federal OW TA _ C10%T42-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715264 5670 Federal (TET P
RTVl4-29B 29 070S 230E 4304715265 5670 Federed ONV PIUn132-30B 30 070S 230E 4304715268 5670 Federed CA¥ P
RTV32-15B 15 070S 230E 4304715270 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 12-20B 20 070S 230E 4304715272 5670 Federal OW S
FCW'12-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715274 5670 Federal CTYV P
R3N32-26B 26 070S 230E 4304715275 5670 Federal (19V 104
RW 31-28B 28 070S 230E 4304715283 5670 Federal OW TA
FØW34-30B 30 070S 230E 4304715288 5670 Federal (39V P
R3¥23-26B 26 070S 230E 4304715290 5670 Federal (39V S
RV/41-33A 33 070S 220E 4304715294 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 43-24B 24 070S 230E 4304715295 5670 Federal GW TA
ItWV12-14B 14 070S 230E 4304715296 5670 Federal ()NV S
RW 32-28C 28 070S 240E 4304715302 5670 Federal GW P
RW 23-25A 25 070S 220E 4304715305 5670 Federal OW P
RW 41-8F 08 080S 240E 4304720014 5670 Federal |GW
FDW44-21C 21 070S 240E 4304730149 5670 Federal (39V S
RW 13-27B 27 070S 230E 4304730199 5670 Federal OW TA
RM/21-34B 34 070S 230E 4304730258 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 43-26B 26 070S 230E 4304730259 5670 Federal OW TA
RNVl4-18C 18 070S 240E 4304730309 5670 Federed Ogr p
RW 12-26B 26 070S 230E 4304730311 5670 Federal OW TA
ILVV32-24B 24 070S 230E 4304730313 5670 Federal ONV P
RM/34-18C 18 070S 240E 4304730314 5670 Federed ONV P
RM/21-19C 19 _070S 240E 4304730340 5670 Federed GNV P
RM/ 14-25B 25 070S 230E 4304730341 5670 Federal OTV P
RW 32-35B 35 070S 230E 4304730342 5670 ederal OW TA
RMT 12-36B 36 070S 230E 4304730344 5670 Federal ()TV S

Bonds:BLM = ESBOOOO24
BIA= 956010693

State=965010695 2 of



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH

eñectiveJune 14,2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease |RNV22-14B 14 070S 230_E4304730345 5670 Federed _ONV P

RMT42-13B 13 070S 230E 4304730346 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 23-19C 19 070S 240E 4304730348 5670 Federal GW P
RW 22-18C 18 070S 2 3087 5670 Federal OW P
BOW22-17C 17 070S 240E 4304730388 5670 Federal GNV P
RW 44-26B 26 070S 230E 4304730520 5670 Federal GW P
RW 42-27B 27 070S 230E 4304731051 5670 Federal OW TA
RW 44-27B 27 070S 230E 4304731053 5670 Federal OW TA
RNV44-23B 23 070S 230E 4304731054 5670 Federed GAV P
RNVll-35B 35 070S 230E 4304731079 5670 Federed ONV PFEn122-35B 35 070S 230E 4304731082 5670 Federal ()TV P
FCA'33-23B 23 070S 230E 4304731476 5670 Federal GVV TA
RNVll-24B 24 070S 230E 4304731477 5670 Federed CA¥ PECn142-21B 21 070S 230E 4304731478 5670 Federed ONV P
RNVl3-24B 24 070S 230E 4304731517 5670 Federed CA¥ P
RNV42-23B 23 070S 230E 4304731576 5670 Federed GAV TA
RNVl2-35B 35 070S 230E 4304731578 5670 Federed ONV S
FCW'24-15B 15 070S 230E 4304731579 5670 Federal ONV P
RMT24-18C 18 070S 240E 4304731582 5670 Federed GMT P
RW 43-15B 15 070S 230E 4304731682 17643 Federal GW DRL C
FUn'34-17B 17 070S 230E 4304731819 5670 Federal ONV PEUgr41-4F 04 080S 240E 4304732538 5670 Fedend (iñT TA
RTV23-23C 23 070S 240E 4304732629 5670 Federed GVV P
RIVl4-17B 17 070S 230E 4304732738 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 32-17B 17 070S 230E 4304732981 5670 Federal OW P
RM/32-18B 18 070S 230E 4304733018 5670 Federed ONV P
RNV42-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733490 5670 Federed ONV P
FCW'22-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733491 5670 Federed COW P
RM/24-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733492 5670 Federal ONV P
ICW'22-21B 21 070S 230E 4304733522 5670 Federed ONV S
RW 24-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733523 5670 Federal OW P
RW 44-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733524 5670 Federal OW P
ICW44-20B 20 070S 230E 4304733525 5670 Federed ONV P
RM/24-18B 18 070S 230E 4304733554 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 42-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733556 5670 Federal OW P
RTV22-19B 19 070S 230E 4304733559 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 23-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733567 5670 Federal OW P
RNV42-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733569 5670 Federed ONV P
RW 21-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733576 5670 Federal OW P
RW 41-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733579 5670 Federal OW P
IUn'21-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733592 5670 Federed OM' P
RW 44-18B 18 070S 230E 4304733594 5670 Federal OW
RW 41-24A 24 070S 220E 4304733769 5670 Federal OW P
104'42-30B 30 070S 230E[4304733771 5670 Federed ONV S

Bonds:BLM=ESBOOOO24
BIA= 956010693

State=965010695 3 of



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
RED WASH

efectiveJune 14,2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

R3WU44-30B 30 070S 230E 4304733772 5670 Federal ONV P
RNV22-25A 25 070S 220E 4304733786 5670 Federal ONV PPJüf34-27C 27 070S 240E 4304735045 5670 Federal GVV P
RTV3=‡-22C 22 070S 240E 4304735098 5670 Federed GNV P
ÍËVÏ35Ï23rtG 23 070S 220E 4304735668 5670 Federal ()VV P
RWU 32-27AG 27 070S 220E 4304735670 5670 Federal OW P
RW 14-34AMU 34 070S 220E 4304735671 14277 Federal GW P
RW 44-08FG 08 080S 240E 4304736349 15261 Federal GW P
RMT34-34AD 34 070S 220E 4304736351 16177 Federed (TRT P
RW 33-31 BD 31 070S 230E 4304736357 Federal GW APD C
RW 13-31 BD 31 070S 230E 4304736358 Federal GW APD CRMT21-26AI) 26 070S 220E 4304736768 5670 Federed ONV OPS C
RW 43-26AG 26 070S 220E 4304736769 16575 Federal OW OPS C
R3¥43-23/eG 23 070S 220E 4304736770 5670 Federal OTV OPS C
RW 41-26AG 26 070S 220E 4304736818 5670 Federal OW OPS C
RW 04-25B 25 070S 230E 4304736982 17224 Federal OW P
RW 34-27ADR 27 070S 220E 4304739445 16330 Federal GW P
IUM/32-29Cl3 29 070S 240E 4304739854 Federal GVV AdPDi C
IUMT24-10FD 10 080S 240E 4304739963 Federed GAW APD C
RW 34-20CD 20 070S 240E 4304739964 Federal GW APD C
RW 32-20CD 20 070S 240E 4304739965 Federal _GW APD
RW 24-21CD 21 070S 240E 4304739966 Federal GW APD C
R3W41-28Cl3 28 070S 240E 4304739967 Federal CivV AdPD C
RW 41-33CD 33 070S 240E 4304739968 Federal GW APD C
RW 14-35 AMU 35 070S 220E 4304740051 Federal GW APD C
RW 44-35 AMU 35 070S 220E 4304740052 Federal GW APD
RW 12-17FG 17 080S 240E 4304740602 | Federal GW APD C

Bonds:BL.M= ESBOOOO24
BIA= 956010693

State=965010695 4 of



'a United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PRIDE'+4N

H µ¢ Utah State Office IN ggg|CA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL2 8 2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

mal FrieldhOfficePriaceFie ce Mo Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Eastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS



C

STATE OF UTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS ANDMINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator; QEP ENERGY COMPANY Operator Account Number: N 3700

Address: 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH

cig VERNAL

state UT zip 84078 Phone Number: (435) 781-4369

Well 1
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4304736982 RW 04-25B NWSW 25 7S 23E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

D 17224 18478 2/5/2008 1/1/2012
Comments:

NEW ENTITY FOR WMMFD

Well 2

API Nuinber Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4304736351 RW 34-34AD SWSE 34 7S 22E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

D 16177 18478 6/7/2007 1/1/2012
Comments:

NEW ENTITY FOR WMMFD G .

Well 3
API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4304739445 RW 34-27ADR SWSE 27 7S 22E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

D 16330 18478 8/7/2007 1/1/2012
Comments ~

NEW ENTITY FOR WMMFD

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Valyn Davis

ARdeans
n i

frexistngeen ty (gren
to ohr existing entity

N ( leasé Prin

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a newentity signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Regulatory Affairs Analyst 4/4/2012

RECElVED m. o.
"°"'

APRO4
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