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DEPARTMENT OF Tt INTERIQR o > LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
001 BUREAU OF LAND MATAGEMENT : UTU-73904
' T 6. IF INDIAN, ALOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK
1a. TYPE OF WORK DRILL EDEEPEN 1 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
1b. TYPE OF WELL
OIL GAS SINGLE MULTIPLE 8 FARM OR LEASE NAME
wewL [ wirL K| othER [ Jzove [ Jzone [j, Lizard Creek
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 9 WELL NO.
Rosewood Resources, Inc. #11-1
10. FIELD AND POOL OR WILDCAT

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR

P.0. Box 1668 Vernal, UT 84078 “Wildeat |\ j1o(s Gignate of

11. SEC, T, R, M, OR BLK.

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements. *)
At Surface 810’ FNL 1002' FWL b p 29.880/0] | anpsurveyorarea
At proposed Prod. Zone NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E 3447 - 109 Y30 SEC 11 T11S R22E
4415 ys3y ’ 47 |810' FNL 1002' FWL
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE* L 12. County 13. STATE
Approximately 25 miles South of Ouray, Utah, Uintah Utah
15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED* LOCATION TO NEAREST PROPERTY 16.NO. OF ACRES IN LEASE 17.NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL
OR LEASE LINE, FT.(Also to nearest drdg. unit line, if any)
810’ 1600 40

18. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION® TO NEAREST WELL, 15. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTARY OR CABLE TOOLS

DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR APPLIED FOR ON THIS LEASE, FT.

None 8500' Rotary
21, ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. APPROX. DATE WORK WILL START*
5119' ungraded GR Upon Rig Availability
3. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE SIZE OF CASING WEIGHT/FOOT SETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT
12 1/4" 9 5/8" 36# 1000 550 sx - Circulate to surface
7 7/8" 412" 11.6# 8500' 1360 sx - Cement to surface

Rosewood Resources, Inc. proposes to drill a well to 8500’ to test the Wasatch and Mesa Verde formations. If productive,
casing will be set and the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and abandoned as per BLM & StateHETe!E IVE D

requirements.
See Onshore Order No. 1 attached. CONFIDENTIAL-TIGHT HOLE FEB 18 2005

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Nationwide Bond no. MT-0627. The principal is Rosewood ResBhed35, Qe GAR & MINING

Surety consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2
IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : I proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new productive zone.

If proposal is to drill ordeepmdirecﬁonaﬂy,givepﬂﬁnemdataonsubswfuelocniansmdmemcd and true vertical depths. Give blowout preventer program, if any.

24.sxcmp.n —L/T/?{Qﬂﬂ/ OMV TMLE  Administrative Assistant DATE Q'(g{)r

(This space for F‘Q,‘l Or State office use)

PERMITNO. L!S—D 4y7-3 l,ff 1 APPROVAL DATE

Application approval does not warmant ar certifyy that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those Tights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL, IF ANY:

RADLEY G. HILL
WB;RQNMEMAL,SGQIENTIST m o= (R -24-05

APPROVED BY

*See Instructions On Reverse Side
itle 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it 2 crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
Ise, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Pedersl Approvel of this
Action Is Necessary
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ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.

Well location, LIZARD CREEK #11-1, Ioco—ted as
shown in the NW 1/4 NW 1/4 of Section 11,
TS, R22E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah.
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% SCALE
~ CERTIFICATE
! THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS' PREPARED FROM
_3 FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME ‘OR UNDER MY )
5 SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME ARE AND CORRECT TO TP-(
8 BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND . .,
= /
REGISTERED LAND SURVEYCR
REGISTRATION NO. 161319
STATE OF UTAH .
NB9'S8'W ~ 5294.52° (G.L.0.) . -
BASIS OF BEARINGS UNTaH FNGINEERING & IaND RVEYING
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL UTAH 84078
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. (435) 789-1017
LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUS NAD 83) SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:
LATITUDE = 39'52°48.39" (39.880108) 1" = 1000 2-3-05 2-8-05
L_ = 90" symBoL LONGITUDE = 109°25'41.43" (109.428175) PARTY REFERENTES
@® - PROPOSED WELL HEAD. (AUTONOMOUS NAD 27) G.S. D.L K.G. G.L.O. PLAT
A LATTUDE = 39'52°48.51" (39.880142) WEATHER FILE
= SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE = 109'25'38.98" (109.427494) COLD ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.
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Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office

Verua UT 84075 RECEIVED
FEB 18 205

To Whom it May Concern; DIV oF OIL, GAS & MINING

Rosewood Resources, Inc. would like to respectfully request that the suspension of exploration be extended
on lease UTU 73904 in the Bitter Creck area due to Rosewood’s intended drilling operations. An APD has
been submitted to the BLM Vernal Field Office and upon approval and rig availability Rosewood intends
to drill on this acreage. The proposed location is as follows: NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E 810°FNL
1002°FWL.

Thank you for your patience in this matter.

Sincerely,

UL

JilY Henrie
Administrative Assistant
Rosewood Resources, Inc
P.O. Box 1668

Vernal, Utah 84078
Jill_henrie@rosewd.com

U25-189- 0414 X/o

Rosewood Resources, Inc.
265 East 100 South

P.O. Box 1668

Vernal, Utah 84078

435 789-0414

435 789 0479 (Fax)
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ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHT HOLE
Rosewood Resources, Inc.
Lizard Creek #11-1 Lease No. UTU-73904

810’ FNL 1002’ FWL

NW % NW % Sec. 11, T11S, R22E

Uintah County, Utah DRILLING PROGRAM
Page 1

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full
compliance is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore
Order No. 1 and the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible
for the actions off his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished
the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Estimated Tops of Important Geologic Markers

Formation Depth Subsea
Uintah A Surface +5119°
Wasatch 3400’ +1719°
Mesa Verde 5660’ -541°

T.D. 8500° -3381°

2. Estimated Depth of Anticipated Water, Oil, Gas or Mineral Formations

Substance Formation Depth
Gas/Qil Wasatch 3400’ — 5660°
Gas/Qil Mesa Verde 5660° — 8500’

All fresh water or prospectively valuable minerals encountered during
drilling will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil
and gas shows will be tested to determine commercial potential.

3. Pressure Control Equipment

Rosewood’s minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are as
follows:

Ram Type: 10” Hydraulic double with annular, 3000# psi W.P.
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Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved
stack working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 70% of internal yield
pressure rating of casing. Pressure shall be maintained for at least 10
minutes or until test requirements are met, whichever is longer. If a test plug
is utilized, no bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizing a test
plug, no more than a 10% decline in pressure in a 30 minute time period will
be acceptable. Valve on casinghead below test plug must be open during test.

Annular type preventers shall be tested to 50% of rated working pressure.
Pressure shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or until test requirements

are met, whichever is longer.
As a minimum, the above test shall be performed:

When initially installed

Whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
Following related repairs

30-day intervals

R

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all
downstream valves open.

When testing kill line valve(s) the check shall be held open or ball removed.
Annular preventers shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need
not be performed more than once a day.

A BOP safety drill shall be conducted weekly for drilling crews.
Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.

All prescribed tests and or drills shall be recorded in the daily drilling log.
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BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted
before drilling out from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in
place. Blowout preventer controls will be installed prior to drilling the surface
casing plug and will remain in place until well operations are completed. Preventers
will be inspected and operated at least daily to ensure good mechanical working
order, this will be recorded on daily drilling report.

The BLM District Office shall be notified with sufficient lead time to have
their representative on location during BOPE testing.

a.

The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached
diagram. Although a rig has not been chosen to drill this well, most of
the equipment on rigs drilling in this area utilize a 10” 30004% W.P.
blowout preventer.

A choke line and a kill line will be properly installed. The kill line will
not be used as a fill-up line.

The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide
repeated operation of hydraulic preventers.

Drill string safety valve(s) to fit all tools in the drill string will be
maintained on the rig floor while drilling operations are in progress.

4, Proposed Casing and Cementing Program:

a.

The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as
approved to protect and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially
productive zones, lost circulation zones, abnormally pressured zones
and any prospectively valuable mineral deposits. Any isolating
medium other than cement shall receive approval prior to use. The
casing setting depth shall be calculated to position the casing seat
opposite a competent formation sufficient to handle maximum
pressure to which it may be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on
all relevant factors, including; presence/absence of hydrocarbons;
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Fracture gradients; usable water zones; formation pressures; lost
circulation zones; other minerals or unusual characteristics. All

indications of usable water shall be reported.

b. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.44 to
0.50 psi per foot for exploratory wells.

c. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi
per foot for exploratory wells.

d. Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches on all
sides in the hole/casing annulus, with recognition that variances can
be granted for justified exceptions.

e. All waiting on cement times shall be adequate to achieve a minimum
of 500 psi compressive strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

f. All casing except the conductor casing shall be new or reconditioned
tested used casing that meets or exceeds API standards for new
casing.

g. The surface casing shall be cemented to surface either during the

primary cement job or by remedial cementing.

h. All indications of usable water shall be reported to the AO prior to
running the next string of casing or before plugging orders are
requested, whichever occurs first.

i Three centralizers will be run on the bottom three joints of surface
casing with a minimum of one centralizer per joint staring with the
shoe joint.

j Top plugs shall be used to reduce the contamination of cement by

displacement fluid. A bottom plug or other acceptable technique,
such as a preflush fluid, inner string cement method, etc. shall be
utilized to help prevent cement contamination.
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k. All casing strings below the conductor shall be tested to 0.22 psi per

m.

Purpose
Surface

foot of casing length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to
exceed 70% of the minimum internal yield. If pressure declines more
than 10% in 30 minutes, corrective action will be taken.

On all exploratory wells and on that portion of any well approved for
a SM BOPE system or greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing
shoe shall be performed. Formation at the shoe shall be tested to a
minimum of the mud weight anticipated to control the well to the next
casing point. This test shall be performed before drilling more than

20’ of new hole.
The proposed casing program will be as follows:

Depth _Hole Size 0O.D. Weight Grade Type New or Used
0-1000° 12 14” 9 5/8” 36# K-55 ST&C New

Production 0-8500° 7 7/8” 4%”  11.6# N-80 LT&C New

1.

Casing design subject to revision based on geological conditions
encountered.

The cement program will be as follows:

Surface Type and Amount

0-1000° 550 sx Class “G” with 2% CaCl and
Ya#t/sk Cello-Flake.

Production Type and Amount

0-8500° 1* Stage: 1000 sx Class “G” with 2% Gel,

2% Micro-Bond .3% CFR 3, 0.5% Halad
9 & Y#/sk Cello-Flake. Top of cement on
1% stage @ 3400°. Cement stage tool @
3000 +/-,

2™ Stage: 360 sx Prem Lite with 3% Salt,
2% Micro-Bond, 1% Econolite and Y4#/sk
Cello-flake. Top of cement on 2™ Stage
@ surface,
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p. Anticipated cement tops will be reported as to depth; not the expected
number of cement sacks to be used. The District Office will be
notified, with sufficient lead to have an AO to witness running all
casing strings and cementing.

q. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing shall
stand idle until the cement has reached a compressive strength of at
least 500 psi at the shoe. WOC time shall be recorded in the driller’s

log.

r. The following reports shall be filed with the District Office within 30
days of completing work.

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5 (formerly 9-331) “Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells”, must include complete
information concerning:

a. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size, weight,
grade of casing set, hole size, setting depth, amounts
and type of cement used, whether cement circulated to
surface or top of cement behind casing, depth of
cementing tools used, casing test method and results
and the date performed. Show the Spud date on the
first reports submitted.

b. Temperature or bond logs must be submitted for each
well where cement was not circulated to surface.

S. Auxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:
1. Kelly Cock Valve
2. No bit float is deemed necessary.

3. Sub with full opening valve.
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S. Mud Program

a.

The proposed circulating mediums to be used during drilling are as
follows:

Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Vise. F/L. PH
0-500° Air/Clear Water 8.3 ppg --- N/C -~
500-2000° Clear Water 8.3 ppg - N/C -
2000-8500° Water/Gel 8.4-9.7 30-40 8 -~

There will be sufficient mud on location to control a kick should one
occur,

A mud test will be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to
determine, as applicable: density, viscosity, gel strength, static
filtration loss and PH.

Mud monitoring equipment to be vsed is as follows:

1. Periodic checks will be made each tour of the mud system. The
mud level will be monitored visually.

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal
and/or Indian Lands without prior BLM approval to ensure adequate
protection of fresh water aquifers.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title III in an amount
equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored,
transported or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of
this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as
defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used,
produced, stored, transported or disposed in association with the
drilling of this well.

The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform to 43 CFR
3610.2-3.



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

_ )

CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHT HOLE

Rosewood Resources, Inc.

Lizard Creek #11-1 Lease No. UTU-73904
810° FNL 1002’ FWL

NW % NW ¥ Sec. 11, T11S, R22E

Uintah County, Utah DRILLING PROGRAM

S.

Page 8

Evaluation Program

The anticipated type and amount of testing and coring are as follows:

a.

No Drill Stem Tests are anticipated, however, if DST’s are run, the
following requirements will be adhered to:

Initial opening of DST tools shall be restricted to daylight hours
unless specific approval to start during other hours is obtained from
the AO. However, DST’s may be allowed to continue at night if the
test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate of flow is
stabilized and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is
adequate for visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers
can be released, but tripping shall not begin before daylight, unless
prior approval is obtained from the AO. Closed chamber DST’s may
be accomplished day or night.

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall
be reversed out of the test string under controlled surface conditions.
This would involve some means for reverse circulation.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be
properly installed before a test starts.

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to run
during the test shall have spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.

An ATT/GR/CDL/ML/GR will be run from the surface casing to T.D.

No cores will be run,

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or a producer, a “Well
Completion and Recompletion Report and Log” (Form 3160-4) will be
submitted not later than 30 days after completion of the well or after
completion of operations, in accordance with 43 CFR 3164. Two
copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well test data,
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geologic summaries, sample description and all pertinent information
compiled during the drilling, completion and/or workover operations.

e. The anticipated completion program will be to test prospective zones
in the Mesa Verde and Wasatch Formations by perforating and
fracture stimulation.

f. Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to
the Vernal Office on a weekly basis.

7. Abnormal Temperatures or Pressures

a. The expected bottom hole pressure is 3000 psi
b. No hydrogen sulfide gas, no abnormal pressures or temperatures are
anticipated.
8. Anticipated Starting Dates and Notification of Operations
a. Drilling will commence as soon as rig is available.

b. It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately

10 days.

c. The BLM in Vernal, Utah will be notified of anticipated dates to begin
road & location construction and spud date.

d. No location will be constructed or moved without approval from the

AO. If well is plugged or suspended, prior approval from the AO
must be obtained and notification given before resuming operations.

e

The spud date will be reported orally to the AO within 48 hours after
spudding. If well is spud on a weekend or holiday, the report will
submitted the following regular work day. Follow oral report with
Sundry Notice.
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f. In accordance with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, this well will be
reported on Form 3160-6 “Monthly Report of Operations”, starting
with the month in which operations commence and continue each
month until the well is physically plugged and abandoned. This
report will be filed with the Vernal BLM District Office, 170 South
500 East, Vernal, Utah 84078

g Immediately Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents or any
other unusual occurrences will be promptly reported in accordance
with the requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

h. A Completion Rig will be moved in following drilling operations. All
conditions of this approved plan are applicable during the completion
operations.

i Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will
be notified when the well is placed in a producing status. Such
notification will be sent by telegram or other written communications,
not later than S days following the date the well is put on line.

Je Pursuant to Onshore Order no. 7, with the approval of the District
Engineer, produced water may be temporarily disposed of into
unlined pits for a period of up to 90 days. During the period so
authorized, an application for a permanent disposal method, along
with the required water analysis and other information, must be
submitted to the District Engineer.

k. Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare
gas during initial well evaluation tests, not exceeding 30 days or the
production of S0 MMCF of gas, whichever occurs first. An
application must be filed with the District Engineer and approval
received, for any venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial 30 day
period.
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L A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5
(b.9.d.), shall be submitted to the appropriate District Office within
sixty (60) days of installation or first production, whichever occurs
first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Order No. 3
shall be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving
hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively sealed in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.4.)

m. A first production conference will be scheduled within 15 days after
receipt of the first production notice.

n. No well abandonment operations will commence without prior
approval of the AO. In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures,
and in emergency situations, oral approval will be obtained from the
SO. A “Subsequent Report of Abandonment” Form 3160-5 will be
filed with the AO within 30 days following abandonment operations.
This report will indicate where plugs were placed and the current
status of the surface restoration. Final abandonment will not be
approved until the surface reclamation work required by the
approved APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed
to the satisfaction of the AO or the surface managing agency.

0. Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, lessees and operators
have the responsibility to see their exploration, development,
production and construction operations are conducted in a manner
which conforms with applicable Federal, State and Local laws and
regulations.



noP SCHEMATC

3000 PSI WORKIMG PRESSURE PLAHVIEW: CHOKE: MAMIFOLD
s LARE GAS DUSTER
: FLARE (IF AVAILABLE)
FLovLI I m—h..
DRI NG — . o [l 27=2000 psi wp
HPPLE — —{| DAL VALVE
‘nn.—m* L 2"-2000
PSI Wi DALL BLEED /PAHIC
—‘ VALVE = LHIE (37)
2" [:‘_li_lq
AIULAR 1 2-3"-3000
(3000 PSI wp) 'n B rs we plue
107 X 3000 pst . T -
- o ==3 VALVES
'~ SHAFFER TLANGE ~
— —— E=3 3"-3000 pst wp PLUG
HN===! =m—nm—mir VALVE W/GAUGE
__l l -0 0 [¢] (1] (]
C ' SHAITFR o _1:] _I—— = T - 2:;'_3()(.)—(: I’VSI—l:l'_‘D «
LD RALAS ) 2-3"=3000 Psi WP PLUG VALVES  ADJUSTADLE MANNAL
(DOUNLE RAN | ADWISTIBLE WANDAL  wir b VALVES - POSHIVE CIIOKE
IIORAULIC BopP - POSIIVE CHOE FROM CHOKE
C 3000 psi yar) 4 LHE
PIPE RAMS i ‘ o
| I =
3000 Pl "l (<) 3000 PSI PRESSURE GAUGE
273000 pSEwe | ‘
CHECK VALVE

373000 PSE W VALVE

C@::( D.SA. ]:[XHX]T) 373000 PSE WP VALWE

23000 Pst ya AUTOMANC CHOKE
VALVES (2) CHOKE LINE (L1
KL LE —I
BULL PLUG ] CASIIG 1EAD ]—[X]-, 2"~ 3000 PSI WP VALVE TEHYDRAULIC CLOSING ULIT WILL BE LOCATED MORE THAN
” - ) 30T RO WIE VELLIEAD. C10KE AND DLEED /PAMIC LINES
i WIHEL GO 0 TME PIT ALID FLARE, ALL COUMNECYIONS It
SUIEACE CHOKE LIMES AND MAHIFOLD WILL DE FLANGED OR WELDED,
CASIIG AL TLANGES

SHOMLD DE NG JokT GASKET 1YPE. ALl
AURNS 1 LIHES SHALL BE CONS IRUGTIED USHIG TARGETNG
907 1EES OR ELLS. ALL LIES SHALL DE ANCHORED,




[

N’
ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHT HOLE
Rosewood Resources, Inc.
Lizard Creek #11-1 Lease No. UTU-73904
810’ FNL 1002’ FWL
NW % NW % Sec. 11, T11S, R22E
Uintah County, Utah SURFACE USE PLAN
Page 1
ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS
Location Construction - Forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction of location
and access roads.
Location Completion - Prior to moving in drilling rig.
Spud Notice - At least twenty-four (24) hours prior to spudding the
well,
Casing String and - Twenty-four (24) hours prior to running casing and
Cementing cementing all casing strings.
BOPE and Related - Twenty-four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
Equipment Tests
First Production - Within five (5) business days after new well begins or
production resumes after well has been off line for more
than ninety (90) days.

The onsite inspection for the subject well is scheduled for Friday, Feb 25th,
2005 at approximately 8:00 a.m. Scheduled to meet are the following individuals:

Stephanie Howard Bureau of Land Management

Dixie Sadlier Bureau of Land Management
Robert Kay Uintah Engineering & Land Survey
Danny Widner Rosewood Resources, Inc.

Jill Henrie Rosewood Resources, Inc.

1. Existing roads

a. The proposed well is located approximately 25 miles south of Ouray, Ut.
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b. Directions to the location from Bonanza, Utah are as follows:

a.

Proceed south on State Road 45 (paved) for 4 miles. Turn south (left)
on the Book Cliffs road (dirt). Proceed 3.9 miles to the Greeks Corral.
Turn west (right) at the fork in road. Proceed 8.3 miles to Asphalt
Wash sign. Stay to the right of the sign. Proceed .7 miles to Rainbow
sign. Stay to the west (right). Follow to Bitter Creek Road signs. Go
to Bitter Creek Corrall. Turn North and follow Bitter Creek 4.5
Miles to location on left hand side of road.

For location of access roads within 2-mile radius, see Maps A & B.

Improvement to the existing access (BLM and County Roads) will not
be necessary.

All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during
all drilling and completion operations associated with this well.

Existing roads and any newly constructed roads will be maintained in
accordance with the standards of the Surface Managing Agency.

Planned Access Roads

The last 300’ of proposed access will be flat bladed with minimal
disturbance. The remainder of the access is maintained by the
County Road Dept. or is a BLM road.

The maximum grade of the new construction will be approximately
3%.

No turnouts are planned at this time.

There are no major cuts or fills. No culverts and/or bridges will be
required.

The new access road was centerline flagged at the time of staking.
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f. The use of surfacing material is not anticipated, however it may be

necessary depending on weather conditions.

g. No cattleguards will be necessary.

h. Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the
approved location and access route. Any additional area needed will

be approved in advance.

i Access roads and surface disturbing activities will conform to
standards outlined in the Bureau of Land Management and Forest

Service publication: Surface Operating Standards for Oil and Gas
Exploration and Development. (1989)

Je The road will be constructed/upgraded to meet the standards of the
anticipated traffic flow and all weather road requirements.
Construction /upgrading shall include ditching, draining, graveling,
crowning and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well
constructed and safe road. Prior to upgrading, the road shall be
cleared of any snow cover and allowed to dry completely. Traveling
off the 30 foot right-of-way will not be allowed. Road drainage
crossings shall be of the typical dry creek crossing type. Crossings
will be designed to prohibit siltation or accumulation of debris in the
crossing nor shall the drainage be blocked by the road. Erosion of
barrow ditches by runoff water shall be prevented by diverting water
at frequent intervals by means of cutouts. Upgrading shall not be
allowed during muddy conditions. Should mud holes develop, they
shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.

k. If the well is productive, additional water drainage would be added to
keep water off the roadway.

L No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title III in an amount
equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored,
transported or disposed of annually in association with drilling of this
well,

m., No road right-of-way will be required at this time.
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3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1-Mile Radius of the Proposed Location.
See Map “B”.

a.

Water wells — none

b. Injection wells — none
c. Producing wells —one : Westport Oil & Gas. Bitter Creek #1-3 Well
SW/NE SEC 3 T11N R22E
d. Drilling wells — none
e. Shut-in wells — none
f. Temporarily abandoned wells — none
g Disposal wells —none
h. Abandoned wells — none
L Dry Holes — none
4. Location of Tank Batteries and Production Facilities.

a.

All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed
or installed (including Pumping Units) will be painted Olive Black.
All facilities will be painted within six months of installation.
Facilities required to comply with Occupational Safety and Health
Act (OSHA) will be excluded.
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b. If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, they
will be surrounded by a containment dike of sufficient capacity to
contain 1 % times the contents of the largest tank or vessel, unless
more stringent protective requirements are deemed necessary by the
AO.

C. A typical production layout is attached. If at the time of production it
is determined that an alternate layout is necessary, a Sundry Notice
will be submitted showing placement of all production facilities prior
to construction.

d. All load lines will be placed inside the containment dike.

e. Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the
wellhead. The gas flowline will be buried or anchored down from the
wellhead, to the meter and 500 feet downstream of the meter run.
Meter runs will be housed and/or fenced.

f. The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well
location. The oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to
any deliveries. Tests for meter accuracy will be conducted monthly
for the first three months and at least quarterly thereafter. The AO
will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration
and on all future calibrations. A copy of the calibration reports will
be submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement
facilities will conform with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 5 for
natural gas measurement.

g If at any time the facilities located on public land and authorized by
the terms of the lease are no longer included in the lease (due to a
contradiction in the unit or other lease or boundary change), BLM
will process a change in authorization to the appropriate statute. The
authorization will be subject to appropriate rental or other financial
obligation as determined by the AQ.
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h. Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent wildlife entry.

i All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will
be adhered to.
J- All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement or commingling on-lease

or off-lease will have prior approval from the District Manager.

k. All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion
and accommodate year-round traffic.

L. The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

m. The surface pipeline will be 4” welded steel and will be 2700’ in
length. The pipeline route is shown on Map “C”.

5. Location and Type of Water Supply
a The proposed water source for this well is the Rock House 5A.
b.
c. Water will be hauled over the roads shown on Maps “A” and “B”.
6. Source of Construction Material

a. Surface and subsoil materials in the inmediate area will be utilized.

b. Any gravel used will be obtained from a commercial source.
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The use of materials under BLM juristiction will conform with 43
CFR 3610.2.3. Construction material will not be located on lease.

No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Disposal

a.

The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break or allow
discharge.

The reserve pit will be lined with 10 mil. Plastic liner. The pit area
will be sufficiently bedded with either straw or felt prior to installing
liner. The liner will overlap the pit walls and be covered with dirt or
rocks to hold it in place. No trash, scrap pipe, etc. that could puncture
the liner will be disposed of in the pit. More stringent protective
requirements may be deemed necessary by the AO.

Burning will not be allowed. Al trash will be contained in a trash
cage and its contents hauled to an approved disposal facility.

After first production, produced water will be confined to a pit or
storage tank for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days. During this
time, in accordance with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for
approval of a permanent disposal method and location, along with
water analysis, will be submitted for the AO's approval.

Drill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling
system will be disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

A chemical portable-toilet will be furnished with the drilling rig.
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8. Ancillary Facilities

There are no airstrips, camps or other facilities currently planned during the
drilling of this well.

9, Well Site Layout

a.

The operator or dirt contractor shall contact the BLM Office at (435)
789-1362, forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction activities.

The reserve pit will be on the northwest side of the location.

The flare pit will be located downwind of the prevailing wind
direction on the northwest side, a minimum of 100 feet from the
wellhead and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.

The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches) will be stored on the southeast
and northeast corners of the location as shown on the Pit & Pad
Layout. No separate topsoil pile for the reserve pit reclamation will
be utilized. Topsoil along the access route will be windrowed on the
uphill side.

Trees will be stockpiled separately from the topsoil and subsoil on
southwest corner off location.

Access to the well pad will be from the south as shown in the Pit &
Pad Layout.

See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad,
cuts and fills.

The location of mud tanks, reserve pit, trash cage, pipe racks and
living facilities are also shown on the Location Layout.



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHT HOLE
Rosewood Resources, Inc.

Lizard Creek #11-1

Lease No. UTU-73904

810’ FNL 1002’ FWL
NW %4 NW % Sec. 11, T11S, R22E

Uintah County, Utah SURFACE USE PLAN
Page 9
i During construction, all brush/trees will be removed from the well

pad and access road to be stockpiled separately from the topsoil piles
as shown in the Pit & Pad Layout.

je All pits will be fenced to the following minimum standards:

1.

39 inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of
barbed wire on top of the net wire (barbed wire is not
necessary if pipe or some type of reinforcement rod is attached
to the top of the entire fence).

2. The net wire shall be no more than 2 inches above the ground.
The barbed wire shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total
height should be at least 42 inches.

3. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a
manner to keep the fence tight at all times.

4. Standard steel, wood or pipe posts shall be used between the
corner braces. Maximum distance between any two posts shall
be no greater than 16 feet.

5. All wire shall be stretched, by using a stretching device, before
it is attached to the corner posts.

k. The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during the drilling

operations and on the fourth side when the rig is moved off the
location. Pits will be fenced and maintained until cleanup.
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10. Plans for Restoration of Surface Producing I.ocation

a.

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area
will be cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials,
trash and junk not required for production.

Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall
be removed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

The plastic nylon reinforced liner shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling the reserve pit.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for
production facilities/operations will be contoured to approximate the
original contours of the site.

Reclamation of unrequired areas on the well pad/access road no
longer needed for operations will be accomplished by grading, leveling
and seeding as recommended by the AO.

The seed mixture requested by the BLM for reclamation of the
drillsite will be determined upon completion of the onsite inspection.

Seeding will be performed with approval from AO. Generally seeding is performed
in the Fall prior to permanent ground freezing. Seed will be drilled or broadcast
and seed walked in with dozer.

f.

The topsoil stockpile will be seeded with above determined seed
mixture.
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Drv Hole

g At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall
submit a Subsequent Report of Abandonment and the AO will attach
the appropriate surface rehabilitation conditions of approval.

Surface Ownership

Access Roads - All roads are county maintained or managed by the BLM.

Well pad - The well pad is located on lands managed by the BLM.

Mineral Ownership

The minerals are owned by the Federal Government and have been leased by
Rosewood Resources, Inc.

Other Information

a. A Class IIT archeological survey has been conducted by Sagebrush
Archeology. A copy of this report will be sent directly to the
appropriate agencies by Sagebrush Archeology.

b. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who
are associated with this project that they will be subject to prosecution
for knowingly disturbing and/or collecting artifacts from historic or
archeological sites. If historic or archeological materials are
uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately halt all
operations and contact the AO. Within five working days the AO will
inform the operator as to:

-whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of
Historic Places;
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-the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake
before the site can be used (assuming in situ preservation is not

necessary); and

-a time frame for the AO to complete an expedited review under 36
CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation
Officer, that the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation is
appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate activities
to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with
this process. The AO will assume responsibility for whatever
recordation and stabilization of the exposed materials that may be
required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for mitigation
costs. The AO will provide technical and procedural guidelines for
the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from the AO that
required mitigation has been completed, the operator will then be
allowed to resume construction.

c. The operator will control noxious weeds along rights-of-way for
roads, pipelines, well sites or other applicable facilities. A list of
noxious weeds may be obtained from the BLM, or appropriate
County Extension Office. On BLM administered land it is required
that a Pesticide Use Proposal shall be submitted, and given approval,
prior to the application of herbicides, pesticides or other potentially
hazardous chemicals.

d. Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this
well site will not be stacked or stored on Federal Lands after the
conclusion of drilling operations or at any time without BLM
authorization.

e. A Diversion Ditch will be constructed around north edge of location.
See Pit & Pad Layout.
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f. All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner

that full compliance with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil
and Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations and any applicable
Notice To Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of
his subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD shall be on location
during construction and drilling activities.

g A complete copy of the APD shall be on location during construction
of location and drilling activities.

h. There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or
workover program without prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling
and operating practices shall be observed. All wells, whether drilling,
producing, suspended or abandoned will be identified in accordance

with 43 CFR 3162.

i “Sundry Notice and Report on Wells” (Form 3160-5) will be used to
request plan changes and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.3-2.

je This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of
approval. An extension period may be granted, if requested, prior to
the expiration of the original approval. After permit termination, a
new application will need to be filed for any future operations.

k. The operator or his contractor shall contact the BLM Offices at (435)
789-1362 48 hours prior to beginning construction activities.

L The BLM Office shall be notified upon site completion prior to
moving in the drilling rig.

m. In the event after-hours approval is necessary, please contact one of
the following individuals:

Jerry Kenczka Petroleum Engineer (435)781-1190
BLM Fax Machine (435)789-3634
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13.  Lessee’s or Operator’s Representatives

ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.
P.O. Box 1668

Vernal, Utah 84078

435/789-0414 (O)

Permit Matters
Jill Henrie — 435/789-0414 Ext. 10

Drilling & Completion Matters
Danny Widner — 435/789-0414 Ext. 11 (Office)

435/828-6100 (Mobile)

Certification

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have
inspected the proposed drillsite and access route; that I am familiar with the
conditions which presently exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to
the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and, that the work associated
with the operations proposed herein will be performed by Rosewood
Resources, Inc. and it’s contractors and subcontractors in conformity with
the plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a
false statement.

2505 /@ﬁlﬁ@- é/ﬂ//c%%/

Date: Danny Widne/ef
Drilling Supefintendant

Rosewood Resources, Inc.




A Class III Archaeological Survey has been
conducted by Sagebrush Archaeology. A copy of
this report will be submitted directly to the
appropriate agencies by Sagebrush

Consultants, L.L.C.
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WORKSHEET '
0 0 3 APFLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL\/

APD RECEIVED: 02/18/2005 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-36316

WELL NAME: LIZZARD CREEK 11-1
OPERATOR: ROSEWOOD RESOURCES INC ( N7510 )

CONTACT: JILL HENRIE PHONE NUMBER: 435-789-0414

PROPOSED LOCATION:

NWNW 11 1108 220E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SURFACE: 0810 FNL 1002 FWL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 0810 FNL 1002 FWL
UINTAH Engineering
UNDESIGNATED ( 2 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-73904

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal
PROPOSED FORMATION: MVRD

LATITUDE: 39.88010

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.4275
RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:
_~/_ Piat R649-2-3.
A4 Bond: Fed[l] Ind[] Sta[] Feel] .
Unit
(No. MT-0627 )
N potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General
Al 0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
4 Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No. 49 -1547] ) v/ Drilling Unit
k( RDCC Review (Y/N)
(Date: ) Board Cause No: QH0- 0"-{
’ Eff Date: Ho1n_ 2004,
UR Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting: ' ! :
l b
R649-3-11. Directional Drill
COMMENTS :
STIPULATIONS: I- £ e O aﬁprwa_\ﬁ

y
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Utah Oil Gas and Mining

PREPARED BY: DIANA WHITNEY
DATE: 18-FEBRUARY-2005




State of Utah

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director
Division of
Oil, Gas & Mining

MARY ANN WRIGHT
Acting Division Director

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 o facsimile (801) 359-3940 « TTY (801) 538-7458 « www.ogm.utah.gov

| — ~—’

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

February 24, 2005

Rosewood Resources, Inc.
P O Box 1668
Vernal, UT 84078

Re:  Lizzard Creek 11-1 Well, 810' FNL, 1002' FWL, NW NW, Sec. 11,
T. 11 South, R. 22 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

- Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This a'pproval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36316.

Sincerely,
John R. Baza
Associate Director
pab
Enclosures

cc:  Uintah County Assessor , .
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

Uliih!

Where ideas connect™



Operator: Rosewood Resources, Inc.

Well Name & Number Lizzard Creek 11-1

API Number: 43-047-36316

Lease: UTU-73904

Location: NW NW Sec. 11 T. 11 South R. 22 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
. Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
. Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.
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\umxuwx 1 7’\-1}
‘. lovase Qluc} mpuc: L/CLCLUUT) 31, 1L
g UNITED STATF®
‘ DEPARTMENT OF THA_ATERIOR “wpod. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
_00S  BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-73904
6. IF INDIAN, ALOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK
1a. TYPE OF WORK DRILL DEEPEN . 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
1b. TYPE OF WELL
OIL GAS SINGLE 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
werL [ wirL K| OTHER | JzonE | Lizard Creek
2. NAME OF OPERATOR 5 WELL NO.
Rosewood Resources, Inc. : i Lo e #11-1
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 10. FIELD AND POOL OR WILDCAT
P.0. Box 1668 Vernal, UT 84078 wantear Lhdt 57 gnatzd
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) J 9 7 qy q 3 / 11. SEC., T.,R., M., OR BLK.
asufce  870' FNL 1293' FWL L, 3y5kox =T AND SURVEY OR AREA
At proposed Prod. Zone NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E _ -10 7. 424440  |SEC 11 T11S R22E
Y4915 You f 870' FNL 1293' FWL
14. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE* 12. County 13. STATE
Approximately 25 miles South of Ouray, Utah. Uintah Utah
15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED* LOCATION TO NEAREST PROPERTY 16. NO. OF ACRES IN LEASE 17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL
OR LEASE LINE, FT.(Also to nearest drlg. unit line, if any)
870 1600 40
18. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION* TO NEAREST WELL, 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. ROTARY OR CABLE TOOLS
DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR APPLIED FOR ON THIS LEASE, FT.
None 8500' Rotary

21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc.) 22. APPROX. DATE WORK WILL START*

5131' ungraded GR Upon Rig Availability
23.  PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE SIZE OF CASING 'WEIGHT/FOOT SETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT
12 1/4" 9 5/8" 3o# 1000’ 550 sx - Circulate to surface
77/8" 41/2" 11.6# 8500’ 1360 sx - Cement to surface

Rosewood Resources, Inc. proposes to drill a well to 8500' to test the Wasatch and Mesa Verde formations. If productive,
casing will be set and the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and abandoned as per BLM & State of Utah

requirements.

See Onshore Order No. 1 attached. CONFIDENTIAL-TIGHT HOLE

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Nationwide Bond no. MT-0627. The principal is Rosewood Resources, Inc. via

surety consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2
IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new productive zone.

Ifproposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout preventer program, if any.

24‘51@1513%& Q%H Q m Uw TITLE Administrative Assistant DATE L_) - l@ ’0 5

(This space fa}\Be/detal or State office use)
PERMIT NO. I‘I:}" -0 l{ 7- 3 L3 | w APPROVAL DATE
Application approval does not warant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the spplicant to conduct operations thereon.

ms_ BRADLEY Q. HILL o= _ DS~ 230
NMENTAL SCIENTIST I

*See Instructions On Reverse Side
Title 18 U.S.8_Sggtion 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction. R E C E ' VE D

MAY 19 2005
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

'Eoderal Approval of this
Action is Necessary
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BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.
LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUS NAD 83)

l_ = 90" SYMBOL

@ - PROPOSED WELL HEAD.
A

n

SECTION CORNERS LOCATED.

LATITUDE = 39'52°47.79" (39.879942)
LONGITUDE = 109°25'37.71" (109.427142)
(AUTONOMOUS NAD 27)

LATITUDE = 39'52'47.91" (39.879975)
LONGITUDE = 10925'35.26" (109.426461)

nuonwUUbD RESOURCES, INC. -

Revised: 4-7-05

r

Well location, LIZARD CREEK #11-1, located as

shown in the NW 1/4 Nw 1/4 of Section 1.
TS, R22E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah. *

BASIS OF ELEVATION

SPOT ELEVATION LOCATED AT THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OF
SECTION 12, T11S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE BUCK
CAMP CANYON, QUADRANGLE, UTAH UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5
MINUTE QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE
UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL

SURVEY. SAID ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 5973
FEET.

™ . ™
[} (@] Qo
= 3 ° =
SCALE
CERTIFICATE

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME. ARE TRUE AND CORRECT TO Ty
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BEL) . T(

REGISTERED LAND SURVEYOR -
REGISTRATION NO. 161319 -
STATE OF UTAH = . .-

Untan FNGINEERING & [anD  SRVEYING

86 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078
(435) 789-1017

SCALE DATE SURVEYED:  [DATE DRAWN:
1" = 1000’ 2-3-05 2-8-05
PARTY REFERENCES
G.S. D.L K.G. G.L.O. PLAT
WEATHER

COLD

FILE

ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHT HOLE
Rosewood Resources, Inc.
Lizard Creek #11-1 Lease No. UTU-73904

870’ FNL 1293’ FWL

NW % NW ¥ Sec. 11, T11S, R22E

Uintah County, Utah DRILLING PROGRAM
Page 1

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full
compliance is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore
Order No. 1 and the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible
for the actions off his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished
the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Estimated Tops of Important Geologic Markers

Formation Depth Subsea
Uintah A Surface +5119°
Wasatch 3400’ +1719°
Mesa Verde 5660’ -541°

T.D. 8500’ -3381°

2. Estimated Depth of Anticipated Water, Oil, Gas or Mineral Formations

Substance Formation Depth
Gas/Oil Wasatch 3400° — 5660°
Gas/Oil Mesa Verde 5660’ — 8500’

All fresh water or prospectively valuable minerals encountered during
drilling will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil
and gas shows will be tested to determine commercial potential.

3. Pressure Control Equipment

Rosewood’s minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are as
follows:

Ram Type: 10” Hydraulic double with annular, 3000# psi W.P.



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHT HOLE
Rosewood Resources, Inc.
Lizard Creek #11-1 Lease No. UTU-73904

870’ FNL 1293’ FWL

NW % NW % Sec. 11, T11S, R22E
Uintah County, Utah DRILLING PROGRAM
Page 2

Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved
stack working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 70% of internal yield
pressure rating of casing. Pressure shall be maintained for at least 10
minutes or until test requirements are met, whichever is longer. If a test plug
is utilized, no bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizing a test
plug, no more than a 10% decline in pressure in a 30 minute time period will
be acceptable. Valve on casinghead below test plug must be open during test.

Annular type preventers shall be tested to 50% of rated working pressure.
Pressure shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or until test requirements
are met, whichever is longer.

As a minimum, the above test shall be performed:

a When initially installed

b. Whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
c Following related repairs

d 30-day intervals

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all
downstream valves open.

When testing kill line valve(s) the check shall be held open or ball removed.
Annular preventers shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need
not be performed more than once a day.

A BOP safety drill shall be conducted weekly for drilling crews.
Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.

All prescribed tests and or drills shall be recorded in the daily drilling log.
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ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHT HOLE

Rosewood Resources, Inc.

Lizard Creek #11-1 Lease No. UTU-73904
870’ FNL 1293’ FWL

NW % NW Y Sec. 11, T11S, R22E

Uintah County, Utah

DRILLING PROGRAM
Page 3

BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted
before drilling out from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in
place. Blowout preventer controls will be installed prior to drilling the surface
casing plug and will remain in place until well operations are completed. Preventers
will be inspected and operated at least daily to ensure good mechanical working
order, this will be recorded on daily drilling report.

The BLM District Office shall be notified with sufficient lead time to have
their representative on location during BOPE testing.

a.

a‘

The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached
diagram. Although a rig has not been chosen to drill this well, most of
the equipment on rigs drilling in this area utilize a 10” 3000# W.P.
blowout preventer.

A choke line and a kill line will be properly installed. The kill line will
not be used as a fill-up line.

The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide
repeated operation of hydraulic preventers.

Drill string safety valve(s) to fit all tools in the drill string will be
maintained on the rig floor while drilling operations are in progress.

Proposed Casing and Cementing Program:

The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as
approved to protect and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially
productive zones, lost circulation zones, abnormally pressured zones
and any prospectively valuable mineral deposits. Any isolating
medium other than cement shall receive approval prior to use. The
casing setting depth shall be calculated to position the casing seat
opposite a competent formation sufficient to handle maximum
pressure to which it may be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on
all relevant factors, including; presence/absence of hydrocarbons;



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHT HOLE
Rosewood Resources, Inc.
Lizard Creek #11-1 Lease No. UTU-73904

870’ FNL 1293’ FWL

NW % NW ¥4 Sec. 11, T11S, R22E
Uintah County, Utah DRILLING PROGRAM
Page 4

Fracture gradients; usable water zones; formation pressures; lost
circulation zones; other minerals or unusual characteristics. All
indications of usable water shall be reported.

b. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.44 to
0.50 psi per foot for exploratory wells.

c. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi
per foot for exploratory wells.

d. Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches on all
sides in the hole/casing annulus, with recognition that variances can
be granted for justified exceptions.

e. All waiting on cement times shall be adequate to achieve a minimum
of 500 psi compressive strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

f. All casing except the conductor casing shall be new or reconditioned
tested used casing that meets or exceeds API standards for new
casing.

g The surface casing shall be cemented to surface either during the

primary cement job or by remedial cementing.

h. All indications of usable water shall be reported to the AO prior to
running the next string of casing or before plugging orders are
requested, whichever occurs first.

I Three centralizers will be run on the bottom three joints of surface
casing with a minimum of one centralizer per joint staring with the
shoe joint.

J Top plugs shall be used to reduce the contamination of cement by

displacement fluid. A bottom plug or other acceptable technique,
such as a preflush fluid, inner string cement method, etc. shall be
utilized to help prevent cement contamination.



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHT HOLE
Rosewood Resources, Inc.
Lizard Creek #11-1 Lease No. UTU-73904

870’ FNL 1293’ FWL
NW %4 NW % Sec. 11, T11S, R22E

Uintah County, Utah DRILLING PROGRAM
Page 5
k. All casing strings below the conductor shall be tested to 0.22 psi per

foot of casing length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to
exceed 70% of the minimum internal yield. If pressure declines more
than 10% in 30 minutes, corrective action will be taken.

On all exploratory wells and on that portion of any well approved for
a SM BOPE system or greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing
shoe shall be performed. Formation at the shoe shall be tested to a
minimum of the mud weight anticipated to control the well to the next
casing point. This test shall be performed before drilling more than
20’ of new hole.

The proposed casing program will be as follows:

Depth Hole Size 0O.D. Weight Grade Type New or Used

0-1000° 12 44” 95/8” 36# K-55 ST&C New

Production 0-8500° 77/8” 4%” 11.6# N-80 LT&C New

m.
Purpose
Surface

n.

0.

Casing design subject to revision based on geological conditions
encountered.

The cement program will be as follows:

Surface Type and Amount

0-1000° 550 sx Class “G” with 2% CaCl and
Va#/sk Cello-Flake.

Production Type and Amount

0-8500° 1% Stage: 1000 sx Class “G” with 2% Gel,

2% Micro-Bond .3% CFR 3, 0.5% Halad
9 & Ya#/sk Cello-Flake. Top of cement on
1% stage @ 3400°. Cement stage tool @
3000’ +/-.

2" Stage: 360 sx Prem Lite with 3% Salt,
2% Micro-Bond, 1% Econolite and Y#/sk
Cello-flake. Top of cement on 2™ Stage
@ surface.
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p- Anticipated cement tops will be reported as to depth; not the expected
number of cement sacks to be used. The District Office will be
notified, with sufficient lead to have an AO to witness running all
casing strings and cementing.

q. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing shall
stand idle until the cement has reached a compressive strength of at
least 500 psi at the shoe. WOC time shall be recorded in the driller’s

log.

r. The following reports shall be filed with the District Office within 30
days of completing work.

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5 (formerly 9-331) “Sundry
Notices and Reports on Wells”, must include complete
information concerning:

a. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size, weight,
grade of casing set, hole size, setting depth, amounts
and type of cement used, whether cement circulated to
surface or top of cement behind casing, depth of
cementing tools used, casing test method and results
and the date performed. Show the Spud date on the
first reports submitted.

b. Temperature or bond logs must be submitted for each
well where cement was not circulated to surface.

s. Aucxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:
1. Kelly Cock Valve
2, No bit float is deemed necessary.

3. Sub with full opening valve.
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S. Mud Program

a.

The proposed circulating mediums to be used during drilling are as
follows:

Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. F/L. PH
0-500° Air/Clear Water 8.3 ppg - N/C -
500-2000° Clear Water 8.3 ppg - N/C -
2000-8500° Water/Gel 8.4-9.7 30-40 8 -

There will be sufficient mud on location to control a kick should one
occur.

A mud test will be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to
determine, as applicable: density, viscosity, gel strength, static
filtration loss and PH.

Mud monitoring equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Periodic checks will be made each tour of the mud system. The
mud level will be monitored visually.

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal
and/or Indian Lands without prior BLM approval to ensure adequate
protection of fresh water aquifers.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title ITI in an amount
equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored,
transported or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of
this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as
defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used,
produced, stored, transported or disposed in association with the
drilling of this well.

The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform to 43 CFR
3610.2-3.
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s. Evaluation Program

The anticipated type and amount of testing and coring are as follows:

a.

No Drill Stem Tests are anticipated, however, if DST’s are run, the
following requirements will be adhered to:

Initial opening of DST tools shall be restricted to daylight hours
unless specific approval to start during other hours is obtained from
the AO. However, DST’s may be allowed to continue at night if the
test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate of flow is
stabilized and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is
adequate for visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers
can be released, but tripping shall not begin before daylight, unless
prior approval is obtained from the AO. Closed chamber DST’s may
be accomplished day or night.

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall
be reversed out of the test string under controlled surface conditions.
This would involve some means for reverse circulation.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be
properly installed before a test starts.

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to run
during the test shall have spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.

An AIT/GR/CDL/ML/GR will be run from the surface casing to T.D.
No cores will be run.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or a producer, a “Well
Completion and Recompletion Report and Log” (Form 3160-4) will be
submitted not later than 30 days after completion of the well or after
completion of operations, in accordance with 43 CFR 3164. Two
copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well test data,
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geologic summaries, sample description and all pertinent information
compiled during the drilling, completion and/or workover operations.

e. The anticipated completion program will be to test prospective zones
in the Mesa Verde and Wasatch Formations by perforating and
fracture stimulation.

f. Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to
the Vernal Office on a weekly basis.

7. Abnormal Temperatures or Pressures

a. The expected bottom hole pressure is 3000 psi

b. No hydrogen sulfide gas, no abnormal pressures or temperatures are
anticipated.

8. Anticipated Starting Dates and Notification of Operations

a. Drilling will commence as soon as rig is available.

b. It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately
10 days.

The BLM in Vernal, Utah will be notified of anticipated dates to begin
road & location construction and spud date.

o
.

d. No location will be constructed or moved without approval from the
AO. I well is plugged or suspended, prior approval from the AO
must be obtained and notification given before resuming operations.

e. The spud date will be reported orally to the AO within 48 hours after
spudding. If well is spud on a weekend or holiday, the report will
submitted the following regular work day. Follow oral report with
Sundry Notice.
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f. In accordance with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, this well will be
reported on Form 3160-6 “Monthly Report of Operations”, starting
with the month in which operations commence and continue each
month until the well is physically plugged and abandoned. This
report will be filed with the Vernal BLM District Office, 170 South
500 East, Vernal, Utah 84078

g. Immediately Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents or any
other unusual occurrences will be promptly reported in accordance
with the requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

h. A Completion Rig will be moved in following drilling operations. All
conditions of this approved plan are applicable during the completion
operations.

i Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will
be notified when the well is placed in a producing status. Such
notification will be sent by telegram or other written communications,
not later than S days following the date the well is put on line.

J- Pursuant to Onshore Order no. 7, with the approval of the District
Engineer, produced water may be temporarily disposed of into
unlined pits for a period of up to 90 days. During the period so
authorized, an application for a permanent disposal method, along
with the required water analysis and other information, must be
submitted to the District Engineer.

k. Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare
gas during initial well evaluation tests, not exceeding 30 days or the
production of 50 MMCF of gas, whichever occurs first. An
application must be filed with the District Engineer and approval
received, for any venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial 30 day
period.
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L A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5
(b.9.d.), shall be submitted to the appropriate District Office within
sixty (60) days of installation or first production, whichever occurs
first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Order No. 3
shall be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving
hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively sealed in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.4.)

m. A first production conference will be scheduled within 15 days after
receipt of the first production notice.

n. No well abandonment operations will commence without prior
approval of the AO. In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures,
and in emergency situations, oral approval will be obtained from the
SO. A “Subsequent Report of Abandonment” Form 3160-5 will be
filed with the AO within 30 days following abandonment operations.
This report will indicate where plugs were placed and the current
status of the surface restoration. Final abandonment will not be
approved until the surface reclamation work required by the
approved APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed
to the satisfaction of the AO or the surface managing agency.

o. Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, lessees and operators
have the responsibility to see their exploration, development,
production and construction operations are conducted in a manner
which conforms with applicable Federal, State and Local laws and
regulations.



AOP SCHEMATIC
JO00 PGl WORKIMG PRESSURE

FLOWIE 3

brRILLInG
PP E

‘I We-ue L

Al an
(3000 pS1 vy )
WX 3000 psy b
: N SHAFFER FLANGE

——1 |
C ' SHAITFR |
N ULID RAMS L
(DOUME AL l
HYDRAULIC Dop-
- 3000 st vp)
. PIPE RAMS R
— [
273000 PSI g l_ |
CHECK VALVE
KA1 0.S.A. 5+
) . cl}ﬂ'*( 107 X 3000 LIX”X]—)
2°-3000 PSI va

VALVES (2)
KILL LINE l

=]

ST IR RTTH &

CASHIC HEAD

SUIIFACE
CASHIG

Iy
Ar
i

ADJUSTRLE J4ANVAL

]I[X].‘l 27=3000 PSE WP VALYE

PLAM VIEW CHOKE MAMIFOLD

TLARE GAS NUSTER

. (IF AVAILAULE)
N N -

oo I

PSE WP DAL
VMM

"o || 27-2000 Pt wp
—{l "ALL vave

BLEED /PAHIC

=

o 0

pas—

I
. 2-3"=3000 psict—=l4
2-3"=3000 psi

P LHIE (37)
2-3"-3000
[l}:l] PSI Wi plue
WP PLUG VALVES
W PLUG VALVES )
FROM CHOKE

?" -|_o_
=3 VALVES
LIIE

==
_ E=3 3-3000 psi wp pLuG
[ ”__ — _[“ _HI VALVE W /GAUGE
0 0 [\]

ADJUSTANLE ANUAL
POSHIVE CHOKE

POSIIVE ClHOKE

A
@ 3()("[ PSIE PRESSURE GAUGE
3°--3000 pSE wpe VALV

F=-3000 PSE WP VALY
A--3000 py)
AUTOMANE CHOKE,
CHOKE LIOE (1.0.)

HIE NYDRAVLC CLOSHIG UNIT WILL DE LOCATED HORE THAH
30T RO NIE VIELLHEAD, CHOKE A BLEED /PANIC LINES
WL GO 10 TUE PIr A

FLARE. ALL cotmecuons i
CHOKE 1TIMES Anp MAHIFOLD Wil

L BE TLAUGED OR WELDED,

AL FLANGES stiomp nEe RIHG JOINT GASKEY 1YPE. ALL
RIS 1 LIMES SHALL BiE CONSIRUCIED USHIG TARGEING
907 TEES OR FLLS. ALL LIIES SHALL DE AHCHORED,

——



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHT HOLE
Rosewood Resources, Inc.
Lizard Creek #11-1 Lease No. UTU-73904

870’ FNL 1293’ FWL

NW % NW Y% Sec. 11, T11S, R22E
Uintah County, Utah SURFACE USE PLAN

Page 1

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction -  Forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction of location
and access roads.

Location Completion - Prior to moving in drilling rig.

Spud Notice - At least twenty-four (24) hours prior to spudding the
well.

Casing String and - Twenty-four (24) hours prior to running casing and

Cementing cementing all casing strings.

BOPE and Related - Twenty-four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.

Equipment Tests

First Production - Within five (5) business days after new well begins or
production resumes after well has been off line for more
than ninety (90) days.

The following individuals met on Wednesday, May 11™ for the onsite evaluation of
the proposed site.

Stephanie Howard Bureau of Land Management
David Kay Uintah Engineering & Land Survey
Dennis Atwood Rosewood Resources, Inc.

1. Existing roads

a. The proposed well is located approximately 25 miles south of Ouray, Ut.
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Directions to the location from Bonanza, Utah are as follows:

Proceed south on State Road 45 (paved) for 4 miles. Turn south (left)
on the Book Cliffs road (dirt). Proceed 3.9 miles to the Greeks Corral.
Turn west (right) at the fork in road. Proceed 8.3 miles to Asphalt
Wash sign. Stay to the right of the sign. Proceed .7 miles to Rainbow
sign. Stay to the west (right). Follow to Bitter Creek Road signs. Go
to Bitter Creek Corrall. Turn North and follow Bitter Creek 4.5

Miles to location.

For location of access roads within 2-mile radius, see Maps A & B.

Improvement to the existing access (BLM and County Roads) will not
be necessary.

All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during
all drilling and completion operations associated with this well.

Existing roads and any newly constructed roads will be maintained in
accordance with the standards of the Surface Managing Agency.

Planned Access Roads

The last 50° of proposed access will be flat bladed with minimal
disturbance. The remainder of the access is maintained by the
County Road Dept. or is a BLM road.

The maximum grade of the new construction will be approximately
3%.

No turnouts are planned at this time.

There are no major cuts or fills. No culverts and/or bridges will be
required.

The new access road was centerline flagged at the time of staking.
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f. The use of surfacing material is not anticipated, however it may be

necessary depending on weather conditions.

g. No cattleguards will be necessary.

h. Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the
approved location and access route. Any additional area needed will

be approved in advance.

i Access roads and surface disturbing activities will conform to
standards outlined in the Bureau of Land Management and Forest

Service publication: Surface Operating Standards for Oil and Gas
Exploration and Development. (1989)

J- The road will be constructed/upgraded to meet the standards of the
anticipated traffic flow and all weather road requirements.
Construction /upgrading shall include ditching, draining, graveling,
crowning and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well
constructed and safe road. Prior to upgrading, the road shall be
cleared of any snow cover and allowed to dry completely. Traveling
off the 30 foot right-of-way will not be allowed. Road drainage
crossings shall be of the typical dry creek crossing type. Crossings
will be designed to prohibit siltation or accumulation of debris in the
crossing nor shall the drainage be blocked by the road. Erosion of
barrow ditches by runoff water shall be prevented by diverting water
at frequent intervals by means of cutouts. Upgrading shall not be
allowed during muddy conditions. Should mud holes develop, they
shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.

k. If the well is productive, additional water drainage would be added to
keep water off the roadway.

L No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title ITI in an amount
equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored,
transported or disposed of annually in association with drilling of this

well.

m. No road right-of-way will be required at this time.
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3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1-Mile Radius of the Proposed Location.
See Map “B”.

a. Water wells — none
b. Injection wells — none
c. Producing wells —one : Westport Oil & Gas. Bitter Creek #1-3 Well
SW/NE SEC 3 T11N R22E
d. Drilling wells — none
e. Shut-in wells — none
f. Temporarily abandoned wells — none
g Disposal wells —none
h. Abandoned wells — none
i Dry Holes — none
4. Location of Tank Batteries and Production Facilities.

a.

All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed
or installed (including Pumping Units) will be painted Olive Black.
All facilities will be painted within six months of installation.
Facilities required to comply with Occupational Safety and Health
Act (OSHA) will be excluded.
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b. If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, they

will be surrounded by a containment dike of sufficient capacity to
contain 1 % times the contents of the largest tank or vessel, unless
more stringent protective requirements are deemed necessary by the

AO.

c. A typical production layout is attached. If at the time of production it
is determined that an alternate layout is necessary, a Sundry Notice
will be submitted showing placement of all production facilities prior

to construction.
d. All load lines will be placed inside the containment dike.

e. Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the
wellhead. The gas flowline will be buried or anchored down from the
wellhead, to the meter and 500 feet downstream of the meter run.
Meter runs will be housed and/or fenced.

f. The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well
location. The oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to
any deliveries. Tests for meter accuracy will be conducted monthly
for the first three months and at least quarterly thereafter. The AO
will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter calibration
and on all future calibrations. A copy of the calibration reports will
be submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement
facilities will conform with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 5 for
natural gas measurement.

g. If at any time the facilities located on public land and authorized by
the terms of the lease are no longer included in the lease (due to a
contradiction in the unit or other lease or boundary change), BLM
will process a change in authorization to the appropriate statute. The
authorization will be subject to appropriate rental or other financial
obligation as determined by the AO.
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h. Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent wildlife entry.

6.

All site security gnidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will
be adhered to.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement or commingling on-lease
or off-lease will have prior approval from the District Manager.

All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion
and accommodate year-round traffic.

The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

The pipeline will be 2200’ from the well-site to the tie-in point and will
be constructed of welded steel. It will be 4” in diameter and will be
laid on the surface. Rosewood requests that a Right-of-Way be
granted for the last 1450 of pipeline that is highlighted in yellow as
shown on Topo Map C located in SEC 2 118 22E, Uintah County.

Location and Type of Water Supply

a
b.
c.

The proposed water source for this well is the Rock House SA.

Water will be hauled over the roads shown on Maps “A” and “B”.

Source of Construction Material

Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.
Any gravel used will be obtained from a commercial source.

The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform with 43
CFR 3610.2.3. Construction material will not be located on lease.

No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.
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7. Methods of Handling Waste Disposal

a.

The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break or allow
discharge.

The reserve pit will be lined with 10 mil. Plastic liner. The pit area
will be sufficiently bedded with either straw or felt prior to installing
liner. The liner will overlap the pit walls and be covered with dirt or
rocks to hold it in place. No trash, scrap pipe, etc. that could puncture
the liner will be disposed of in the pit. More stringent protective
requirements may be deemed necessary by the AO.

Burning will not be allowed. All trash will be contained in a trash
cage and its contents hauled to an approved disposal facility.

After first production, produced water will be confined to a pit or
storage tank for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days. During this
time, in accordance with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for
approval of a permanent disposal method and location, along with
water analysis, will be submitted for the AO's approval.

Drill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling
system will be disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

A chemical portable-toilet will be furnished with the drilling rig.
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8. Ancillary Facilities

There are no airstrips, camps or other facilities currently planned during the
drilling of this well.

9. Well Site Layout

a.

The operator or dirt contractor shall contact the BLM Office at (435)
789-1362, forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction activities.

The reserve pit will be on the northwest side of the location.

The flare pit will be located downwind of the prevailing wind
direction on the northwest side, a minimum of 100 feet from the
wellhead and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.

The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches) will be stored on the southeast
and northeast corners of the location as shown on the Pit & Pad
Layout. No separate topsoil pile for the reserve pit reclamation will
be utilized. Topsoil along the access route will be windrowed on the

uphill side.

Trees will be stockpiled separately from the topsoil and subsoil on
southwest corner off location.

Access to the well pad will be from the south as shown in the Pit &
Pad Layout.

See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad,
cuts and fills.
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h. The location of mud tanks, reserve pit, trash cage, pipe racks and
living facilities are also shown on the Location Layout.
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i During construction, all brush/trees will be removed from the well

pad and access road to be stockpiled separately from the topsoil piles
as shown in the Pit & Pad Layout.

J All pits will be fenced to the following minimum standards:

1.

39 inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of
barbed wire on top of the net wire (barbed wire is not
necessary if pipe or some type of reinforcement rod is attached
to the top of the entire fence).

The net wire shall be no more than 2 inches above the ground.
The barbed wire shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total
height should be at least 42 inches.

Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a
manner to keep the fence tight at all times.

Standard steel, wood or pipe posts shall be used between the
corner braces. Maximum distance between any two posts shall
be no greater than 16 feet.

All wire shall be stretched, by using a stretching device, before
it is attached to the corner posts.

k The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during the drilling
operations and on the fourth side when the rig is moved off the
location. Pits will be fenced and maintained until cleanup.
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10. Plans for Restoration of Surface Producing Location

a.

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area
will be cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials,
trash and junk not required for production.

Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall
be removed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

The plastic nylon reinforced liner shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling the reserve pit.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for
production facilities/operations will be contoured to approximate the
original contours of the site.

Reclamation of unrequired areas on the well pad/access road no
longer needed for operations will be accomplished by grading, leveling
and seeding as recommended by the AQ.

The seed mixture requested by the BLM during onsite inspection is as
follows: 1 1b Wyoming Big Sage, 3 Ib Shad Scale, 4 Ib Globe Mellow,
4 1b Needle and Thread Grass.

Seeding will be performed with approval from AQ. Generally seeding is performed
in the Fall prior to permanent ground freezing. Seed will be drilled or broadcast
and seed walked in with dozer.

f.

The topsoil stockpile will be seeded with above determined seed
mixture.
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Dry Hole

11.

12.

g At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall
submit a Subsequent Report of Abandonment and the AO will attach
the appropriate surface rehabilitation conditions of approval.

Surface Ownership

Access Roads - All roads are county maintained or managed by the BLM.

Well pad - The well pad is located on lands managed by the BLM.

Mineral Ownership

The minerals are owned by the Federal Government and have been leased by
Rosewood Resources, Inc.

Other Information

a. A Class III archeological survey will be conducted by Sagebrush
Archeology. A copy of this report will be sent directly to the
appropriate agencies by Sagebrush Archeology.

b. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who
are associated with this project that they will be subject to prosecution
for knowingly disturbing and/or collecting artifacts from historic or
archeological sites. If historic or archeological materials are
uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately halt all
operations and contact the AO. Within five working days the AO will
inform the operator as to:
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whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of
Historic Places;

-the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake
before the site can be used (assuming in situ preservation is not
necessary); and

-a time frame for the AO to complete an expedited review under 36
CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation
Officer, that the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation is
appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate activities
to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with
this process. The AO will assume responsibility for whatever
recordation and stabilization of the exposed materials that may be
required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for mitigation
costs. The AO will provide technical and procedural guidelines for
the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification from the AO that
required mitigation has been completed, the operator will then be
allowed to resume construction.

c. The operator will control noxious weeds along rights-of-way for
roads, pipelines, well sites or other applicable facilities. A list of
noxious weeds may be obtained from the BLM, or appropriate
County Extension Office. On BLM administered land it is required
that a Pesticide Use Proposal shall be submitted, and given approval,
prior to the application of herbicides, pesticides or other potentially
hazardous chemicals.

d. Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this
well site will not be stacked or stored on Federal Lands after the
conclusion of drilling operations or at any time without BLM
authorization.
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e. A Diversion Ditch will be constructed around north edge of location.
See Pit & Pad Layout.
f. All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner

that full compliance with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil
and Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations and any applicable
Notice To Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of
his subcontractors. A copy of the approved APD shall be on location
during construction and drilling activities.

g A complete copy of the APD shall be on location during construction
of location and drilling activities.

h. There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or
workover program without prior approval from the AQ. Safe drilling
and operating practices shall be observed. All wells, whether drilling,
producing, suspended or abandoned will be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.

i. “Sundry Notice and Report on Wells” (Form 3160-5) will be used to
request plan changes and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.3-2.

J- This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of
approval. An extension period may be granted, if requested, prior to
the expiration of the original approval. After permit termination, a
new application will need to be filed for any future operations.

k. The operator or his contractor shall contact the BLM Offices at (435)
789-1362 48 hours prior to beginning construction activities.

L The BLM Office shall be notified upon site completion prior to
moving in the drilling rig.
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m. In the event after-hours approval is necessary, please contact one of

the following individuals:

Jerry Kenczka Petroleum Engineer (435)781-1190
BLM Fax Machine (435)789-3634
n. Golden Eagle Stipulation - No drilling or construction will occur

during the Golden Eagle nesting season February 1% thru July 15™.

13. Lessee’s or Operator’s Representatives

ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.
P.O. Box 1668

Vernal, Utah 84078

435/789-0414

Permit Matters
Jill Henrie — 435/789-0414 Ext. 10

Drilling & Completion Matters
Danny Widner — 435/789-0414 Ext. 11 (Office)

435/828-6100 (Mobile)



Lizard Creek #11-1

SELF CERTIFICATION

Please be advised that Rosewood Resources, Inc. is to be considered the operator of the Lizard
Creek #11-1 well located at NW NW SEC 11T11S R22E Lease #UTU-73904 in Uintah County.
Rosewood Resources, Inc. agrees to be responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the

operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Nationwide Bond no. MT-0627. The principal is
Rosewood Resources, Inc. via surety consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2.

CERTIFICATION

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision have inspected the proposed drillsite
and access route: that I am familiar with the conditions which presently exist; that the statements
made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and, that the work associated
with the operations proposed herein will be performed by Rosewood Resources, Inc. and its
contractors and subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and conditions under

which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

Date 5//6/2,00 o/

Dahn idner
Drillin erintendent
Rosewood Resources, Inc.




A Class III Archaeological Survey has been
conducted by Sagebrush Archaeology. A copy of
this report will be submitted directly to the
appropriate agencies by Sagebrush

Consultants, L..L.C.
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\OSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC~

) TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR
o
‘"“ X—Section LIZARD CREEK #11—1
. Scale SECTION 11, T11S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
" = 50° 870" FNL 1293 FWL
DATE: 4-7-05
Drawn By: K.G.

Preconstruction 35’ 120’
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NOTE: = TS T T~
Topsoil should not be —
Stripped Below Finished STA.  0+00
Grade on Substructure Area. * NOTE:
APPROXIMATE YARDAGES FIL QUANTITY INCLUDES
) _ EXCESS MATERIAL = 7470 Cu. Yds.
(6”) Topsoil Stripping = 1,460 Cu. Yds. i ] .
Topsoil & Pit Bockfill = 2,730 Cu. Yds.
Remaining Location = 70,560 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)
EXCESS UNBALANCE = 4,740 Cu. Yds.
TOTAL CUT = 72,020 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)

FILL

4,550 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
: 85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Uiah 84078 * (485) 7891017
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ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.
LIZARD CREEK #11-1

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 11, T11S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
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ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.
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RESOURCES|

4/12/2005

Bureau of Land Management
Vemal Field Office

170 South 500 East

Vemnal, UT 84078

Dear Stephanie;

Rosewood Resources , Inc. has re-staked our Lizard Creek 11-1 well to the new location approximately
200’ to the East as per your request. This new location should be out of the 100 year Bitter Creek Flood
Plain zone. Please review the new NOS and let me know if we can proceed with the APD approval

process.

Administrative Assistant
Rosewood Resources, Inc
P.O. Box 1668

Vernal, Utah 84078

Jill henrief@rosewd.com
435-789-0414 X10

Rosewood Resources, Inc.
265 East 100 South

P.O. Box 1668

Vernal, Utah 84078

435 789-0414

435 789 0479 (Fax)



]

NOTICE OF STAKING ) ~

NOTICE OF STAKING 6. Lease Number
(Not to be used in place of
Application for Permit to Drill Form 3160-3) Ur-73904
1. Qil Well D Gas Well Other 7. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
(Specify)

2. Name of Operator 8. Unit Agreement Name

Rosewovod Resources, Inc.
3. Name of Specific Contact Person 9. Farm or Lease Name
Jill Henrie
4. Address & Phone No. of Operator or Agent 10. Well No.
P.O.Box 1668 Vernal UT 84078 435-789-0414 x10 Lizard Creek £11-1
5. Surface Location of Well 11. Field or Wildcat Name
Attach: a) Sketch showing road entry onto pad, pad dimensions, and 12. Sec, T.,R, M., or

reserve pit. Blk. and Survey or Area

b) Topographical or other acceptable map showing location, 870" FNL 1293 FWL

access road, and lease boundaries. NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E SLB&M

15. Formation Objective(s) 16. Estimated Well Depth
County or Parish 14. State
Wasatch & Mesa Verde or Borough
8500’ Uintah UT

17. Additional Information (as appropriate; shall include surface owner's name, address and, if known, telephone number)

' = ‘5.»"". ; ‘;,r"vm fe s ) o _

13. Signed . 3 | / f / { [//{/z/f/{/f 4 Title Administrative Assistant Date 47122005
7 T VT v

Note: Upon réﬁeipt of this Notice, the Bureau of Land Management (BLM) will schedule

the date of the onsite predrill inspection and notify you accordingly. The
location must be staked and access road must be flagged prior to the onsite.
Operators must consider the following prior to the onsite.

a) H,S Potential

b} Cultural Resources (Archeology)

c) Federal Right of Way or Special Use Permit

IMPORTANT: SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR INSTRUCTIONS
BILLING CODE 4310-54-C
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ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.
LIZARD CREEK #11-1

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 11, T11S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
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HUoBITUULY RESUUKCES, INC. .

Well location, LIZARD CREEK #11-1, located ¢s

shown in the NW 1/4 Nw 1/4 of Section 11,
TS, R22E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah.-

BASIS OF ELEVATION

SPOT ELEVATION LOCATED AT THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OF
SECTION 12, T11S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE BUCK
CAMP CANYON, QUADRANGLE, UTAH UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5
MINUTE QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE

UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL

SURVEY. SAID ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 5973
FEET.
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CERTIFICATE

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME ARE TRUE AND CORRECT TO (

BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BEU?Z : Z

& -
REGISTERED LAND SURVEYOR
REGISTRATION NO. 161319
STATE OF UTAH

Revised: 4-7-05

UNTaH FNGINEERING & [anD SRVEYING
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL UTAH 84078
(435) 789-1017

SCALE DATE SURVEYED:  [DATE DRAWN: |
1" = 1000’ 2—-3-05 2-8-05 ]

PARTY REFERENCES !
G.S. D.L K.G. G.L.0. PLAT

WEATHER

FILE

COLD

ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.
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QOSEWOOD RESOURCES, IN(_,
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JSEWOOD RESOURCES, IN(_

) TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR
(@]
‘"“ X— Section LIZARD CREEK #1-1
. Scale SECTION 11, T11S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
1" = 50° 870" FNL 1293" FWL
DATE: 4-7-05
Drawn By: K.G.

Preconstruction 35" 120

\ { Grade b .
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———

STA. 3+25

35’ 120’ |
Slope= 1 1/2:7
LOCATION STAKE (Typ. except pit)
—
T o o DY
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NOTE: =

Topsoil should not be v
Stripped Below Finished
Grade on Substructure Area.

* NOTE:
FILL QUANTITY INCLUDES

EXCESS MATERIAL

7,470 Cu. Yds.

6”) Topsoil Strippi = 1,460 Cu. Yds.
(87) Topsolil Stripping v. res Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 2730 Cu. Yds.
Remaining Location = 70,560 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)
EXCESS UNBALANCE =4,740 Cu. Yds.
TOTAL CUT = 72,020 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)
FILL = 4,550 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

85 So. 200 Fast * Vernal, Ulah 84078 * (435) 789-1017
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1SVTIAC 2IUG) Dapucy lsclollluct 21, 1771

UNITED STATES

" DEPARTMENT OF TF INTERIOR 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
_BUREAU OF LAND MM~AGEMENT ~|  UTU-73904 -
6. IF INDLAN, ALOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME
APPLICATlON FOR PERMIT TO DRILL, DEEPEN, OR PLUG BACK .
JatreEorwork:  DRILL -DEEPEN 1 7. UNIT AGREEMENT NAME
1b. TYPE OF WELL ;
o GAS SINGLE MULTIPLE o 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
wern [ | werh K| OTHER | JzoNE | |zonE 1 Lizard Creek
2. NAME OF OPERATOR . 9 W'ELL NO.
Rosewood Resources, Inc. 42 v 7. B A, v #11-1
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR M ) M 10. FIELD AND POOL OR WILDCAT
P.0. Box 1668 Vernal, UT 84078 v " Wildcat
4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any Sme requirements. *) 11. SEC., T, R, M., OR BLK.
At Surface 870' FNL 1293' FWL B AND SURVEY OR AREA
At proposed Prod. Zane NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E FEB 17 2005 SEC 11 T11S R22E
‘ 870' FNL 1293' FWL
T4. DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST omcg- ‘ 12, County 13, STATE
Approximately 25 miles South of Ouray, Utah.. R Uintah Utah
15. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED* LOCATION TO NEARESTPROPERTY |16 NO:OFAGRESINLEASE  |17. NO. OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL
OR LEASE LINE, FT.(Also to nearest drlg. unit line, if any)
870" 1600 . 40
18. DISTANCE FROM PROPOSED LOCATION® TO NEAREST WELL, 19, PROPOSED DEFTH 70, ROTARY OR CABLE TOOLS
DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR APPLIED FOR ON THIS LEASE, FT.
None 8500’ Rotarv
21. ELEVATIONS (Show whether DF, RT, GR, etc) o o " 20 APPROX DATE WORK WILL START* o
5131' ungraded GR Upon Rig Availability
23. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE SIZE OF CASING WEIGHT/FOOT SETTING DEPTH QUANTITY OF CEMENT
12 1/4" 9 5/8" 36# 1000’ 550 sx - Circulate to surface
7 7/8" 41/2" 11.6# 8500' 1360 sx - Cement to surface

Rosewood Resources, Inc. proposes to drill a well to 8500' to test the Wasatch and Mesa Verde formations. If productive,
casing will be set and the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and abandoned as per BLM & State of Utah
requirements. '

See Onshore Order No. 1 attaéhed. CONFIDENTIAL-TIGHT HGEE

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Nationwide Bond no. MT-0627. The principal is Rosewood Resources, Inc. via

surety consent as provided for in 43 CFR 3104.2
IN ABOVE SPACE DESCRIBE PROPOSED PROGRAM : If proposal is to deepen or plug back, give data on present productive zone and proposed new productive zone.

If proposal is to drill or deepen directionally, give pertinent data on subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths. Give blowout preventer program, if any.
24. AV -
SIGNEDQ(H,)LH 9 D : TTLE Administrative Assistant DATE F) 1S
] v

(This space fo‘i\E!den.l or State office use)

e

PERMITNO. APPRIFAYEB A e ¥
Application approval does not wamrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the appli to perations thereon.

Assistant Feld Managet /
lperal DasnnrneR DATE az lgl/zw;
NCTICE CF APPROVAL

*See Instructions On Reverse Side
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any depanmem or agencv of the United States any

false, fictitious or fraudulent statements o representations 4s to any matter within its jurisdiction. = T o
RECEIVED

JUL 2 6 2005
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING




COAs Page 1 of 5
Well No.: Lizard 11-1

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: Rosewood Resources, Inc.

Well Name & Number: Lizard 11-1

Lease Number: U-73904

API Number: 43-047-36316

Location: _NWNW Sec. 11 T. 118 R. 22E

Agreement: N/A

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval
for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR NOTICE TO DRILL
Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or-equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations

thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well is
being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

1. Estimated Depth at Which Qil, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearing Zones are Expected
to be Encountered

Report ALL water shows and water-bearing sands to John Mayers of this office prior to setting
the next casing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies of State of Utah form
OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected, submit samples to this office
along with any water analyses conducted.

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLM at onsite)
encountered during drilling, will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas
shows will be tested to determine commercial potential.

2. Pressure Control Equipment

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil & Gas
Order No. 2 for equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc., for a 3M system and
individual components shall be operable as designed. Chart recorders shall be used for all
pressure tests.



COAs Page 2 of 5
Well No.: Lizard 11-1

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while drilling
and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

3. Casing Program and Auxiliary Equipment

None

4, Mud Program and Circulating Medium

None

5. Coring, Logging and Testing Program

A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to the surface casing shoe
and shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy
of the CBL to this office. :

Please submit an electronic copy of all logs run on this well in LAS format. This
submission will supersede the requirement for submittal of paper logs to the BLM. The
cement bond log must be submitted in raster format (TIF, PDF or other).

6. Notifications of Operations

Operator shall report production data to MMS pursuant to 30 CFR 216.5 using form MMS/3160.

The date on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for oil wells as the
date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporary storage facility,
such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or, the date on which
liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent storage facility, whichever first occurs;
and, for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped
from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be
generated or, the date on which gas is first measured through permanent metering facilities,
whichever first occurs.

Should gas be vented or flared without approval beyond the authorized test period, the operator
may be directed to shut-in the well until the gas can be captured or approval to continue venting
or flaring as uneconomic is granted and the operator shall be required to compensate the lessor
for that portion of the gas vented or flared without approval which is determined to have been
avoidably lost.

7. Other Information

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.
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All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling onlease or off-lease will have prior
written approval from the AO.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location. The oil and gas
meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries and tested for meter accuracy at least
quarterly thereafter. The AO will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will
be submitted to the Vernal Field Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform to
Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 5 for
natural gas measurement.

The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover program without prior
approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. All wells,
whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned will be identified in accordance with 43
CFR 3162. ’ '

"Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for approval for all changes of
plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982, as implemented
by the applicable provisions of the operating regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(c), requires
that "not later than the 5th business day after any well begins production on which royalty is due
anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site, or resumes production in the case of a well
which has been off production for more than 90 days, the operator shall notify the authorized
officer by letter or sundry notice, Form 3160-5, or orally to be followed by a letter or sundry
notice, of the date on which such production has begun or resumed."

If you fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time allowed, you shall be liable
for a civil penalty of up to $10,000 per violation for each day such violation continues, not to
exceed a maximum of 20 days. See Section 109(c)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty
Management Act of 1982 and the implementing regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(i).

APD approval is valid for a period of one (1) year from the signature date. An extension period
may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Michael Lee (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435) 781-4410
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EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPT EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, they are not necessarily hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids

Gas plant cooling tower cleaning wastes

Painting wastes

0Oil and gas service company wastes, such as empty drums, drum rinsate, vacuum truck rinsate,
sandblast media, painting wastes, spend solvents, spilled chemicals, and waste acids
Vacuum truck and drum rinsate from trucks and drums, transporting or containing nonexempt
waste

Refinery wastes

Liquid and solid wastes generated by crude oil and tank bottom reclaimers

Used equipment lubrication oils

Waste compressor oil, filters, and blowdown

Used hydraulic fluids

Waste solvents

Waste in transportation pipeline-related pits

Caustic or acid cleaners

Boiler cleaning wastes

Boiler refractory bricks

Incinerator ash

Laboratory wastes

Sanitary wastes

Pesticide wastes

Radioactive tracer wastes

Drums, insulation and miscellaneous solids.
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SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

If any paleontological or cultural materials are encountered, stop work immediately and
report the find to this office.

Paint all facilities Fuller O’Brian color Olive Black (SWA20-6). Any paint brand may be
used provided the colors match.

The authorized officer may prohibit surface disturbing activities during wet and muddy
periods to minimize watershed damage. This limitation does not apply to operation and
maintenance of producing wells.

The seed mix for this location shall be:

Wyoming big sage - Artmisia tridentate 11bs. /acre
Scarlet globemallow Sphaeralcea coccinea 4lbs. /acre
Shadscale Atriplex confertifolia 3lbs. /acre
Indian Ricegrass Stipa hymenoides 41bs. /acre

s All pounds are in pure live seed.

= Reseeding may be required if first seeding is not successful.
4 to 6 inches of topsoil shall be stripped from the location and windrowed as shown on
the cut sheet. The topsoil shall then be broadcast seeded with the recommended seed mix
immediately after it has been windrowed and the seed walked into the soil with a dozer.
The topsoil from the reserve pit shall be stripped and piled separately near the reserve pit.
When the reserve pit is closed, it shall be recontoured and the topsoil respread, and the
area shall be seeded in the same manner as the location topsoil.
Once the location is plugged and abandoned, it shall be recontoured to natural contours,
topsoil respread where appropriate, and the entire location seeded with the recommended
seed mix. Seeding shall take place by broadcasting the seed and walking it into the soil
with a dozer immediately after the dirt work is completed.
Within 90 calendar days of the approval date for this Application for Permit to Drill
(APD), the operator/lessee shall submit to the Authorized Officer (AO), on Sundry
Notice Form 3160-5, an Interim Surface Reclamation Plan for surface disturbance on
well pads, access roads, and pipelines. At a minimum, this will include the reshaping of
the pad to the original contour to the extent possible; the respreading of the top soil up to
the rig anchor points; and, the area reseeded using appropriate reclamation methods. The
AO will provide written approval or concurrence within 30 calendar days of receipt.
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FORM 3160-5 Ul EDSTATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ' Budget Bureau No. 10040135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
S. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73904
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reenter a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals N/A

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
1. Type of Well _
i FREE TN E R g 8. Well Name and No.
on Gas il iy
Well X fwell D Other - Lizard Creek 11-1

9. API Well No.
43-047-36316

2. Name of Operator

ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC. 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
3. Address and Telephone No. Wildcat

P.O. Box 1668, Vernal, UT 435-789-0414 11. County or Parish, State

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)
UINTAH CO., UTAH

NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E 870" FNL 1293' FWL

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(es) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans
Recompletion New Construction
Subsequent Report Plugging Back | Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair | Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection
X | Other Dispose Water
{Note: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13, Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearty state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed
work. If well is directionally drilied, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Rosewood Resources, Inc. has contacted the following drilling companies (Please see attached) to try to
obtain a drilling rig to drill above mentioned well. No rigs were available at this time. This is in order to hold
lease #UTU-73904 . Rosewood will follow up with subsequent reports showing due diligence to obtain a
drilling rig on a monthly basis thereby holding the lease until the rig is obtained and the well can be drilled.

Please call with any concems.
RECEIVED

Thank You,

Jill Henrie

Administrative Assistant, Rosewood Resources, Inc. NOV 1 5 2005

435-789-0414 x10 -
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & Ml

COPIES: ORIG. & 2-BLM; DIV. OG&M; DALLAS OFFICE
14. | hereby certi at the foregoing is true and correct
) A .
Signed ‘ LA ovidud Titte Administrative Assistant Date 11/11/05
N/

(This space for Fédeyal or State office use)
Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a ctrime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States andy false, fictitious or fraudulent



Union Drilling

P.O. Drawer 40

Buckhannon, WV 26201
Shakey Chivers 435-789-2663

Pioneer Drilling

1250 NE Loop 410

San Antonio, TX 78209

Don Lacome 210-828-7689
(Unable to reach. Left message)

Patterson Drilling

1120 East 1500 South
Vernal Ut 84078

Jesse Blanchard 789-4154



FORM 31605 - © UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June ?990)' ) DEPARTMA._. OF THE INTERIOR we’ Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73904
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reenter a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals N/A

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
1. Type of Well
8. Well Name and No.
o Gas
Well X {well Other Lizard Creek 11-1

9. AP| Well No.
43-047-36316

2. Name of Operator

ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC. 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
3. Address and Telephone No. Wildcat
P.O. Box 1668, Vernal, UT 435-789-0414 11. County or Parish, State

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)
UINTAH CO., UTAH

NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E  870' FNL 1293' FWL

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(es) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent [ Abandonment : Change of Plans
Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report | Plugging Back | Non-Routine Fracturing
| Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection
T Other Dispose Water
T (Note: Report results of multiple completion on Well

Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed
work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Rosewood Resources, Inc. has contacted the following drilling companies (Please see attached) to try to
obtain a drilling rig to drill above mentioned well. No rigs were availabie at this time. This is in order to hold
lease #UTU-73904 . Rosewood will follow up with subsequent reports showing due diligence to obtain a
drilling rig on a monthly basis thereby holding the lease until the rig is obtained and the well can be drilled.
Please call with any concerns.

Thank You,

Jill Henrie

Administrative Assistant, Rosewood Resources, Inc.

435-789-0414 x10

COPIES: ORIG. & 2-BLM; DIV. OG&M; DALLAS OFFICE
14. | hereby certify that the foregging is true and correct
Signed il ) Title Administrative Assistant Date  12/09/05
T C Y

(This space for Federajor State office use)
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

RECEIVED

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States andy falmnifsgrfnwlem

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Bill Barrett Corp.
Troy Schindier
303-293-9100

Newfield Energy
Mike Guinn
435-823-2075

Patterson Drilling

1120 East 1500 South
Vernal Ut 84078

Jesse Blanchard 789-4154
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Feb-16-06 08:59A ROSEWOOD RESOURCES (435) 789-0497 P.O1

FORM 3160-5 \<4NITED STATES R E CE I VEFO FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT (}C T 12 7005 Expires: March 31, 1993
b 5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLBLM VEHE ! ;( _ UTU-73904
Do not use this form for propasals to drill or to deepen or reenter a differe ir.U Tm indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposais N/A

© [7. HUnit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A
e RECEIVED
8. Well Name and No.
Qul Gas
Well We" D Other FEB 1 6 2006 Lizard Creek 11-1
.| 9. APl Well No.
2. Name of Operator Div-Of Ot @AS &ttt 43-047-36316
ROSEWOOD RESOQURCES, INC. 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
3. Address and Telephone No. Wildcat
P.O. Box 1668, VVernal, UT 435-789-0414 11. County or Parish, State

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)
UINTAH CO., UTAH

NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E  870' FNL 1293’ FWL

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(es) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
—_—— e TR T DA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ ] notice of ntent : Abandonment : Change of Plans
Recompiletion X | New Construction
D Subsaquent Report : Plugging Back : Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
[ Firai Abandonment Notice : Abering Casing [ conversion to injection
_J Other - Dispose Water
(Note: Report resuits of muttiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompietion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearty state al pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed
work. if well is directionally drilled, give substrface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work )"

Rosewood Resources, Inc. set surface casing on the above mentioned well on 10/15/05 (Please see
attached report). This will adhere to the BLM's requirements that drilling operations have commenced in
order to hold lease #UTU-73904 as stated in attached letter. Rosewood will follow up with subsequent
reports showing due diligence to obtain a drilling rig on a monthly basis thereby holding the lease until the rig
is obtained and the well can be drilled.

VUZNALDIST. __ f 7 e

N Rocouncd i cpud vl Fidey afiafle 4 e R

rt dvilig, we wil 1y dalling yypo

B a
-~
=

l: .&-BLM: DIV. &M:; D OFFIC - “_gq ; L
14. | hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct ' /
vy o | PET. |
Signed ’,g\) y ‘LH'F i Tile Administrative Assistant Date 10/17/05
— A Y :._( !
{This space for Fedérg! or Stats office use) ) - 1 e
Approved by 9 ; Tite pate WGi 27 A

Conditions of approval, if arfy:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes il @ crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make 1o any dapariment or agency of the Unrted States andy false, fictitious or fraudulent

MPERAT



Feb-16-06 08:59A ROSEWOOD RESOURCES (435) 789-0497

~ e’
Lizard Creek 11-1
ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC. Daily Drilling Report
WELL NAME: Lizard Creek #11-1 DATE: 10/15/05

PROPOSED TD:  8500"
Lease #: UTu-73804 . . .
Surface: NW NW SEC 11 T118 R22&
County: UINTAH, UTAH
AP! #43-047-36316

Engineer D. Widner

10/15/2005

e, | DimnONd J (i Oldham) Bulttocation and lined i
Pete Martin Drilling set conductor pipe.

— MIRU 8ill Jr Rathole Dritling, inc,

Drilled 1020 of 12 1/4” hole.
RIH w/ Guide Shoe, +23 its 8 5/8" 32.3% 8 rd H-40 STC New Casing to 996.4'
Big 4 Cementers comented w/ 425 sxs Premium + 2 % CaCl + 1/48/sx Flocele + 2% gel.
Circulated 9 bbis sturty to surface Plug down @ 19:45. Plug Held.
Released Bill Jr. Rig.
Now waiting on Drilling rig
. BLM notified, but did not witness any of these operations.
et e e [Noh Saffle Plate ran 1 jt up from shoe, and lsft 2 bbls cement on top of plug

Daily Cost; $108,747 Cum Cost  $108,747

Page 1



Feb-16-06 09:00A ROSEWOOD RESOURCES

STATE OF UTAH ~’

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

(435) 789-0497

FORM 6

ENTITY ACTION FORM
Operator. _Rosewood Resources, Inc. Operator Account Number: N 7210
Address:  P.O. Box 1668
city Vernal
state UT zip 84078 Phone Number. (435) 789-0414
Well 1
AP! Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | R County
4304736316 Lizard Creek 11-1 NWNWl 1 118 22E Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
A 99999 /5794 1011512005 /16 [o¢
Comments:
D eNTIAL
C
Well 2
APl Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp Rng County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
Comments:
Welt 3
APl Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp { Rng County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date
Comments:
ACTION CODES: .
A - Establish new entity for new weil (single well only) Jil Henrie
B - Add new wel to existing entity (group or unit well) Nam )~
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another oxisting entity j m j
D - Re-assign weil from one existing entity to a new entity Si re
E - Other (Explain in ‘comments’ section) Admistrative Assistant 2/16/2006
RECEIVED Title ./ Date
(6/2000)
FEB 1 6 2006

DIV. OF OiL, GAS & MINING



U*"'TED STATES
DEPARTMwaT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM 3160-5
(June 1990)

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reenter a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
" Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
UTU-73904

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
N/A

1. Type of Well

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
v oy e

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
N/A

8. Well Name and No.

lizard Creek 11-1

D Other
2. Name of Operator

ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.

9. APl Well No.
43-047-36316

3. Address and Telephone No.
P.O. Box 1668, Vernal, UT 435-789-0414

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
Wildcat

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E 870" FNL 1293' FWL

11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH CO., UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(es) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of intent | Abandonment || Change of Plans
Recompletion New Construction
Subsequent Report Plugging Back : Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing | Conversion to Injection

x | other Tight Hole

Dispose Water

(Note: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed
work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertica! depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Rosewood Resources, Inc. respectfully requests confidential status on the above mentioned well. This should
remain in effect for 13 months from completion date. Please call with any questions.

Thank You,

Jill Henrie

Administrative Assistant
Rosewood Resources, Inc.
435-789-0414 x10

COPIES: ORIG. & 2-BLM; DIV. OG&M; DALLAS OFFICE

RECTVED
FEB 2 4 2006
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & Mining

14. | hereby ce i;y\thqt,the foregoing is true and correct
Signed

Title Administrative Assistant Date

02/22/06

(Rl

(This space for F’g\d}fal or State office use)
Approved by Title

Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and wilifully to make to any department or agency of the United States andy false, fictitious or fraudulent



FORM 3160-5
(June 1990)

UNIT O STATES
DEPARTMENY-OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reenter a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
" Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
UTU-73904

6. if indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

1. Type of Well

on Gas
Well Well Other

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
N/A

8. Well Name and No.

Lizard Creek 11-1

2. Name of Operator
ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.

9. APl Well No.
43-047-36316

3. Address and Telephone No.
P.O. Box 1668, Vernal, UT 435-789-0414

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
Wildcat

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E  870' FNL 1293' FWL

11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH CO., UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(es) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent Abandonment | Change of Plans
o Recompletion | New Construction
Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection
| Other | Dispose Water
o (Note: Report results of multiple oompletion_on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed
work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see attached drilling reports on above mentioned well.
If you have any questions please feel free to call.
Thank you,

Jill Henrie

Rosewood Resources, Inc.
435-789-0414 x10

COPIES: ORIG. & 2-BLM; DIV. OG&M; DALLAS OFFICE

RECEIVED
FEB 2 8 2006

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. | hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Titte Administrative Assistant Date

02/24/06

Signed %ﬂt D)

L

(This space for Fe&se( or State office use)
Approved by Title

Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States andy false, fictitious or fraudulent



RG.cWOOD RESOURCES, »<C.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK February 24, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER 'COUNTY Is‘I’ATE DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 6
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs|cum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED  [LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
4525 21 66 9.625 32.3 996' 6
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME |REPORTED BY
DRILLING C.H.
[REMARKS KB TO GL.
16
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail

06:00 | 07:00 1.00 |DRILLING FROM 3680 TO 3710 [WEIGHT 9.6+ 9.7 WATER FLOW DEAD}

7:00 | 09:00 | 2.00 |WORK ON MUD PUMPS [REMOVE ROCK, CEMENT, PVC FROM #1 CHANGE SEAT & VALVE #2
9:00 14:00 | 5.00 |DRILLING FROM 3710 TO 3916

14:00 | 14:30 | 0.50 JRIG SERVICE & B.O.P. DRILL FUNCTION PIPE RAMS ALL PERSONEL TO STATIONS WELL SECURED 4 MIN
14:30 | 22:00 | 7.50 IDRILLING FROM 3916 TO 4233
22:00 | 22:30 | 0.50 ISURVEY AT 4233 =2 1/2 DEGREE
22:30 | 06:00 | 7.50 |DRILLING FROM 4233 TO 4525

“UP 120
DOWN 100
24.00 ROTATE 110
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 3741 NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 1
[TIME 10:00 180 sea mud SIZE 77/8
WEIGHT 9.8 240 barrite MFG HYCOLOG
VIS 47 4 ez-mud TYPE 147
WL 3 baracat JET 3-16 3-14
PV/YP 11 6 impermex SERIAL NO. 111321
H2S 1 baradefoam  |DEPTH ouT
CA 180 3 caustic soda  |DEPTH IN 996
GELS 8/19 15 sawdust [TOTAL FEET
ALK 0.8 2 pot. Chloride [HRS 66
’_pH 10.6 T/B/G
CAKE WT. ON BIT 15
cL 30,000 DAILY COST $11,071.00 |RPM 102
KCL % 3.00% PREVIOUS COST #REF) ROP(fph) 40.0
%SOLIDS 6.1 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL 140.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DWIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NoO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 |PDCBIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO] BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 16" DRILL COLLARY 636.52 |STROKE 8.0 16 2737 172
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 120 4233 21/2
GPM 352
SURF PRESSURE 1325
ECD 11.3 DAILY WELL COST $20,320
SLOW PUMP- SPM 90 JPrEVIOUS CUM COST $355,614
U:\PROD\DDRIGXLS ~ BHA 673.03 |SLOW PUMP- PRES | 790 JCUMULATIVE WELL CoST $375,934




RC_cWOOD RESOURCES, ..C.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK February 23, 2006
|R1G NAME AND NUMBER counTy |srare DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 5
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs|cum Rot. Hrs [FOOTAGE DRILLED  |LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
3680 11.5| 455 9.625 32.3 996' l 5
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME [REPORTED BY
C.H.
REMARKS KB TO GL.
| 16
_———
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 07:30 { 1.50 |DRILLING FROM 3330 TO 3441 [WATER FLOW 25-30GPM]
7:30 08:00 0.50 {LAY DOWN 3 JOINTS DRILL PIPE
8:00 20:00 | 12.00 |SHUT IN WELL OBTAIN SHUT IN PRESSURES, CONDITION MUD TO KILL WATER FLOW,CIRCULATE
WELL THOUGH CHOKE MANNIFOLD ADD 200 BBL KCL,[weight 9.6water flow 4gpm-wt. 9.8 flow Ogpm}
20:00 | 06:00 | 10.00 |DRILLING FROM 3441 TO 3680
UP 120
DOWN 100
24.00 ROTATE 110
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 3341 NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1
TIME 10:30 215 SEA MUD SIZE 77/8
WEIGHT 9.6 3 EZ-MUD MFG HYCOLOG
VIS 80 36 POT. CHLORIDE |TYPE 147
WL 40 58 BARRITE JET 3-16 3-14
PV/YP 20@ 60 3 BARACAT SERIAL NO. 111321
H2S 10 SAWDUST DEPTH OUT
CA 1500 DEPTH IN 996
GELS 5/17 TOTAL FEET
ALK 0.8 HRS 45.5
pH 9.5 T/B/G
CAKE 3 WT. ON BIT 15
CL 2,900 DAILY COST $9,247.00 RPM 102
KCL % 0.08 PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 50.0
S%SOLIDS 7.1 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL 140.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 |6" DRILL COLLARY 636.52 |STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 120
GPM 352
SURF PRESSURE 1200
ECD 9.9 DAILY WELL COST $44,076
SLOW PUMP- SPM 65 Jprevious cum cosT $311,538
U:PROD\DDRLG.XLS ~ BHA 673.03 |SLOW PUMP- PRES | 475 JcuMULATIVE WELL cosT $355,614




ROL-WOOD RESOURCES, I_c.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. AELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK February 22, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER lcounTY lsate ~_|pavno.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH | 4
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrsjcum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Iwm
3330 22 34| 1500 9.625 32.3 996' 4
[ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
DRILLING C.H.
REMARKS XB TO GL.
WATER FLOW | 16
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 10:00 4,00 |DRILLING FROM 1830 TO 2064 [WATER FLOW FROM APPROXIMATELY 1800=25GPM]
10:00 10:30 0.50 |RIG SERVICE
10:30 16:30 6.00 |DRILLING FROM 2064 TO 2512
16:30 17:00 0.50 |SURVEY AT 2512 [MISSRUN]
17:00 19:30 2.50 |DRILLING FROM 2512 TO 2737
19:30 | 20:00 0.50 |SURVEY AT 2737= 1/2 DEGREE
20:00 04:30 8.50 |DRILLING FROM 2737 TO 3249
4:30 05:00 0.50 |SURVEY AT 3249 = 1 DEGREE
5:00 06:00 1.00 {DRILLING FROM 3249 TO 3330 [WATER FLOW HAS NOT QUIT]
UP 120
DOWN 100
24.00 ROTATE 110
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 2062 NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 1
TIME 11:00 3 BARACOR SIZE 77/8
WEIGHT 8.4 4 EZ-MUD MFG HYCOLOG
Vis 28 25 SEAMUD  |TYPE 147
WL 2 BARA CAT JET 3-16 3-14
PV/YP 2 @ 60 6 CAUSTIC SODA |SERIAL NO. 111321
H2S 5 SODA ASH  |DEPTH OUT
CA 1450 DEPTH IN 996
GELS TOTAL FEET
ALK 1.3 HRS 34
pH 10.5 T/8/G
CAKE WT. ON BIT 15
cL 1,800 DAILY COST $5,591.00  |RPM 102
KCL % 80.00% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 69.5
%SOLIDS 0.3 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL 140.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT_|PUMP No. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 |6" DRILL COLLARY 636.52 STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 55
SPM 120
GPM 393
SURF PRESSURE 1400
ECD 9.2 DAILY WELL COST $28,613
SLOW PUMP- SPM 50 |prEVIOUS CuM cosT $282,925
U:\PROD\DDRIGXIS __ BHA 673.03 |sLOwW PUMP- PRES | 500 JcumuLATIVE WELL COST 311,538




RC_EWOOD RESOURCES, _iC.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK February 21, 2006
IRIG NAME AND NUMBER cowery lsTare DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 3
ITOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs jcum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No,
1830 12 9.625 32.3 996' 3
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME JREPORTED BY
DRILLING C.H.
REMARKS KB TO Gl
16
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 09:00 | 3.00 |RUNIN HOLE &TAG CEMENT @ 932
9:00 16:00 7.00 |DIG CEMENT OUT OF VALVES 8& FLOWLINE, THAW PUMPS,REPAIR FUEL LINE,REPLACE WEIGHT IND.
16:00 16:30 0.50 |[TEST PUMPS
16:30 | 17:00 | 0.50 |DRILL OUT PLUG, FLOAT, CEMENT, SHOE
17:00 | 19:00 | 2.00 |DRILLING FROM 996 TO 1200
19:00 19:30 0.50 SURVEY@1200=1/4 DEGREE
19:30 | 03:30 8.00 DRILLING FROM 1200 TO 1711
3:30 04:00 0.50 SURVEY® 1711=1/4 DEGREE
4:00 | 06:00 | 2.00 DRILLING FROM 1711 TO 1830
UP o5
DOWN 85
24.00 ROTATE 20
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 996 NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1
TIME 10:30 SIZE 77/8
WEIGHT 8.4 MFG HYCOLOG
VIS 27 TYPE 147
WL JET 3-16 3-14
PV/YP 1@40 SERIAL NO. 111321
H2S DEPTH OUT
CA 180 DEPTH IN 996
GELS I TOTAL FEET
ALK 0.4 HRS 12
pH 9.3 T/B/G
CAKE WT. ON BIT 15
CL 1,100 DAILY COST $600.00 RPM 102
KCL % 1.00% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 69.5
%SOLIDS 0.2 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! ANVEL |
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 |PDCBIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750
21 |6" DRILL COLLARY 636.52 |STROKE 8.0 16
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5
SPM 120
GPM 393
SURF PRESSURE 1400
ECD DAILY WELL COST $19,620
SLOW PUMP- SPM 50 JerEVIOUS CUM CoST $263,305
U:\PROD\DDRLGXLS ~ BHA 673.03 |sLow PUMP- PRES | 500 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $282,925




RO_ZWOOD RESOURCES, I_C.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK February 20, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER counry Isare DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 2
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrejcum Rot. Hrs [FOOTAGE DRILLED  |LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
9.625 32.3 996' 2
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME IREPORTED BY
C.H.
REMARKS X8 TO GL.
| 16
[ TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 14:30 | 8.50 |PRESSURE TEST P.RAMS B.RAMS CHOKE LINEXMANNIFOLD, KILL, UPPER KELLY, LOWER KELLY,
SAFETY VALVES TO 3000 PSI TEST ANNULAR TO 1500PSI CSG TO1300 PSI
14:30 | 01:30 | 11.00 |RIG UP, WORK ON GEN. & ELECTRICAL PANEL WORK ON RESERVE PIT PUMP ADJUST&REPAIR BRAKES
1:30 | 06:00 | 4.50 |SET WEAR RING, PICK UP BHA & RUN IN HOLE
UP
DOWN
24.00 ROTATE
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH |NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO.
TIME SIZE
WEIGHT MFG
VIS TYPE
WL JET
PV/YP |SERIAL NO.
H2s DEPTH OUT
CA DEPTH IN
GELS TOTAL FEET
ALK HRS
pH T/B/G
CAKE WT. ON BIT
CL DAILY COST RPM
KCL % PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph)
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL :
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT_|PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
MAKE EMSCO| BREW
MODEL F800 | B-750
STROKE
LINER SIZE
SPM
GPM
SURF PRESSURE
ECD DAILY WELL COST $120,415
SLOW PUMP- SPM JprEVIOUS CuM cosT $142,890
U:\PROD\DDRIGXLS  BHA 0.00 SLOW PUMP- PRES JCUMULATIVE WELL cosT $263,305




RC_EWOOD RESOURCES, ._iC.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK 002/19/06
IRIG NAME AND NUMBER (counTy |sTare DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 1
ITOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hre]eum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED  JLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No

9.625 32.3 996' 1
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
TEST BOPs C.H.
REMARKS |KBTO GL

TIME LOG
FROM TO | HOURS Activity Detail
0600 0600 24.00 jRIG UP
UP
DOWN
24.00 _ ROTATE
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO.
TIME SIZE
WEIGHT MFG
VIS TYPE
WL JET
nYP SERIAL NO.
H25 DEPTH OUT
CA DEPTH IN
GELS TOTAL FEET
ALK HRS
pH 1/8/6
CAKE WT. ON BIT
CL DAILY COST RPM
KCL % PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph)
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT_|PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION

MAKE EMSCO| BREW

MODEL F800 | B-750

STROKE

LINER SIZE

SPM

GPM

SURF PRESSURE

ECD DAILY WELL COST $0

SLOW PUMP- SPM JprEVIOUS cum cosT $142,890
UAPROD\DDRLGXLS — BHA 0.00 SLOW PUMP- PRES JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $142,890




FORM 3460-5 Ur "ED STATES FORM APPROVED

{(June 1990) DEPARTMMwT OF THE INTERIOR ~~" " Budget Bureau No. 10040135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73904
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reenter a different reservoir. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT - for such proposals N/A

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A

1. Type of Well

8. Well Name and No.

(o]] Gas f : | - |
ell Well Dmher TN T e Lizard Creek 11-1

9. API Well No.
2. Name of Operator 43-047-36316
ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC. 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
3. Address and Telephone No. Wildcat
P.O. Box 1668, Vernal, UT 435-789-0414 11. County or Parish, State

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)
UINTAH CO., UTAH

NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E 870" FNL 1293' FWL

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(es) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans
| Recompletion New Construction
Subsequent Report | Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection
Other Dispose Water
(Note: Report results of multiple completion on Weli
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed
work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see attached drilling reports on above mentioned well.
If you have any questions please feel free to call.

Thank you,

Jill Henrie

Rosewood Resources, Inc. RECEIVED
435-789-0414 x10 MAR 08 2006

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
COPIES: ORIG. & 2-BLM; DIV. OG&M; DALLAS OFFICE

14. | hereby cen?g:; the foregoing is true and correct

Signed N 'M/U?\, Title Administrative Assistant Date 03/03/06

| DA A

(This space for Federeyr State office use)
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Titie 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States andy faise, fictitious or fraudulent



” ROS../NOOD RESOURCES, -~4C.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202

PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK March 3, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER counTY Jstate DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 13
I TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrsfcum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED  |LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
8076 21| 189 9.625 32.3 J-55 996' 13
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
DRILLING C.H.
REMARKS KB TO GL.
16
TIME LOG
FROM TO | HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 08:30 | 2.50 {DRILLING FROM 7787 TO 7852 [ROP 26 ]
8:30 | 09:00 | 0.50 [RIG SERVICE, B.O.P. DRILL FUNCTION P.RAMS ALL PERSONEL TO STATIONS WELL SECURED2MIN45SH
9:00 15:00 6.00 |DRILLING FROM 7852 TO 7945 [ROP 15,5 ]
15:00 | 16:00 | 1.00 |REPAIR RIG [ CLEAN RADIATOR ON PUMP MOTER ]
16:00 | 01:30 | 9.50 |DRILLING FROM 7945 TO 8042 [ ROP 10 ]
01:30 | 03:00 | 1.50 |HAD GAS BUBBLE,BLEW OFF FLOWLINE,SHUT IN WELL TOOK PRESSURE,CIRC. BOTTUMS UP
03:00 | 06:00 | 3.00 DRILLING FROM 8042 TO 8065 [ROP 7.6 ]
UP 180
DOWN 160
24.00 ROTATE 170
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH **7882%* PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 2 3
TIME 10:30 124 SEA MUD SIZE 77/8 77/8
WEIGHT 10 92 BARRITE MFG HYCOLOG HYCOLOG
VIS 47 9 CAUSTIC SODA |TYPE DSX-146 275
WL 14 WALL NUT JET 3-13 3-18 4-12 4-18
PV/YP 12 25 SAWDUST ___ |SERIAL NO. 103515 109576
H2S 1 SAPP DEPTH OUT 7580
CA 120 DEPTH IN 6794 7580
GELS 10/22 TOTAL FEET 786 485
ALK 1.2 HRS 23.5 35.00
pH 10.3 T/B/G 8- N/A-L
CAKE WT. ON BIT 20000 15K-30K
CL 120 DAILY COST $4,758.00 RPM 102 102
KCL % 2.40% PREVIQUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 33.4 13.8
%SOLIDS 10.3 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL 140.0 140
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 6" DRILL COLLARy{ 636.52 |STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 120 4233 21/2
GPM 380 5227 21/2
SURF PRESSURE 1800 6794 21/2
ECD 11.6 DAILY WELL COST $37,211
SLOW PUMP-SPM | 52 |prEVIOUS CUM cosT $836,629
U:\PROD\DDRLG.XLS BHA 673.03 |SLOW PUMP-PRES | 745 JcUMULATIVE WELL COST $873,840




ROS..NOOD RESOURCES, ..iC.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK March 2, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER ‘COUNTY lSTATE DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 12
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs{cum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED  [LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No.
7787 14| 168| 6584 9.625 32.3 )-55 996' 12
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
C.H.
REMARKS XB TO GL.
&COST INCREASE=RIG MOVE, DIESEL,CAMPS HAUL AND HOOK UP,2PDC BITS"WITH10K DISCOUfl 16
TIME LOG
FROM TO | HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 08:30 | 2.50 |[PULL OUT OF HOLE, LAY DOWN BIT "RING OUT"
8:30 11:30 | 3.00 {CUT AND SLIP 100 FEET OF DRILLING LINE, ADJUST DRAWTOOL BRAKES
11:30 | 16:00 | 4.50 |RUN IN HOLE WITH BIT#3
16:00 | 06:00 | 14.00 |DRILLING FROM 7580 TO 7787
UP 175
DOWN 150
24.00 ROTATE 165
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 0:00 7580 NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 2 3
TIME 11:00 196 BARRITE SIZE 77/8 77/8
WEIGHT 10.1 5 SAPP MFG HYCOLOG HYCOLOG
VIS 49 14 WALLNUT TYPE DSX-146 275
WL PAC-R JET 3-13 3-18 4-12 4-18
PV/YP 9 1 BARA DEFOAM [SERIAL NO. 103515 109576
H2S DEPTH OUT 7580
CA 120 DEPTH IN 6794 7580
GELS 7/20 TOTAL FEET 786 207
ALK 1.2 HRS 23.5 14.00
H 9.9 T/B/G 8- N/A-L
CAKE WT. ON BIT 20000 15K-24K
CL 27,000 DAILY COST $4,758.00 RPM 102 102
KCL % 2.40% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 33.4 14.0
%SOLIDS 9.4 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL 140.0 140
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 |6" DRILL COLLARY 636.52 |STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 120 4233 21/2
GPM 380 5227 21/2
SURF PRESSURE 1800 6794 21/2
ECD 11.5 DAILY WELL COST $299,624
SLOW PUMP- SPM 52 JprEVIOUS CuM cosT $537,005
U:\PROD\DDRLGXLS __ BHA 673.03 |SLOW PUMP- PRES | 690 JcumMuLATIVE WELL cosT $836,629




ROS<WOOD RESOURCES,-\C.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400

DENVER, COLORADO 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK March 1, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER (COUNTY sTaTe DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 11
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrsfcum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED  JLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ No.
7580 17.5| 154| 6584 9.625 32.3 J-55 996' 11
[ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
PULL QUT OF HOLE C.H.
REMARKS KB TO GL.
16
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 13:00 | 7.00 |DRILLING FROM 7025 TO 7306 [ROP40 ]
13:00 | 13:30 0.50 |RIG SERVICE, BOP DRILL FUNCTION P.RAMS ALL PERSONEL TO STATIONS WELL SECURED 3MIN 10SE|
13:30 | 00:00 | 10.50 |DRILLING FROM 7306 TO 7580 [ROP 26 LAST HOUR ROP 5 UNABLE TO INCREASE]
0:00 01:30 1.50 |CIRCULATE MIX DRY PIPE SLUG AND PUMP
01:30 | 06:00 4.50 {PULL OUT OF HOLE
UP 171
DOWN 158
24.00 ROTATE 162
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 0:00 7199%%**% INO, OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1 2
TIME 9:30 120 SEAMUD SIZE 77/8 77/8
WEIGHT 10 10 IMPERMIX MFG HYCOLOG HYCOLOG
VIS 48 1 PAC-R TYPE 147 DSX-146
L DET 3-16 3-14 3-13 3-18
PV/YP 11 SERIAL NO. 111321 103515
H2s DEPTH QUT 6794 7580
CA 80 DEPTH IN 996 6794
GELS 8/19 TOTAL FEET 5798 786
ALK 1.2 HRS 130.5 23.50
pH 9.8 T/B/G 8-N/A-IN
CAKE WT. ON BIT 18000 20000
CL 21,000 DAILY COST $4,589.00 RPM 122 102
KCL % 2.10% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 44.0 44.9
%SOLIDS 9.4 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL 290.0 140
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 16" DRILL COLLARy 636.52 |STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 120 4233 21/2
GPM 380 5227 21/2
SURF PRESSURE 1800 6794 21/2
ECD 11.5 DAILY WELL COST $25,264
SLOW PUMP- SPM 52 JPrEVIOUS cuM cosT $511,741
U:\PROD\DDRLGXLS ~ BHA 673.03__|SLow PUMP- PRES | 685 JCUMULATIVE WELL cosT $537,005




1600 BROADWAY, SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202

ROS<WOOD RESOURCES,-NC.

PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK February 28, 2006
RIG RAME AND NUMBER COUNTY |state DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 10
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrsjcum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED  [LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
7025 6| 136.5 9.625 32.3 J-55 996' l 10
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
DRILLING C.H.
REMARKS KB TO GL.
16
—
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 10:00 4.00 [CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD TO KILL WATER FLOW, PUMP DRY PIPE SLUG
10:00 14:30 4.50 [PULL OUT OF HOLE, RETRIEVE SURVEY 2 1/2 DEGREE, LAY DOWN MOTOR AND BIT [IRON IN HOLE]
14:30 | 18:00 3.50 [PICK UP NEW BIT AND MUD MOTOR, RUN IN HOLE [WATER FLOW INCREASED TO 40 G.P.M.]
18:00 | 21:00 3.00 [STOP AT 2000 TO CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD TO KILL WATER FLOW,
21:00 | 00:00 3.00 [RUN IN HOLE, 30 FILL WORK JUNK IRON TO SIDE OF HOLE
00:00 | 06:00 6.00 [DRILLING FROM 6794 TO 7025
FHRRKXCEMENT BAGS, BLADE, VEHICLES ALL TAKEN CARE OF=BLM VIOLATIONS RESOLVED
FEERXCOST FOR RIG MOVE ,CAMPS HAUL AND SET UP ARE NOT IN YET=MAYBE TOMORROW
uUp
DOWN
24.00 ROTATE
MUD RECORD | MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 0:00 6794 NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME | BIT NO. 1 2
TIME 10:30 180 SEAMUD  |[sizE 77/8 77/8
WEIGHT 10@60 240 BARRITE __ [mMFG HYCOLOG HYCOLOG
VIS 42 98 POT. CHLORIDE |TYPE 147 DSX-146
WL 5 BARA DEFOAM  [JET 3-16 3-14 3-13 3-18
PV/YP 14@60 15 IMPERMIX  |SERIAL NO. 111321 103515
H2s BARACOR DEPTH OUT 6794
CA 80 1 EZ-MUD DEPTH IN 996 6794
GELS 4/9/ CAUSTIC SODA |TOTAL FEET 5798 231
ALK 1 20 SAWDUST HRS 130.5 6.00
pH 10@60 T/B/G 8-N/A-IN
CAKE WT. ON BIT 18000 20000
CL 25,000 DAILY COST $14,472.00 RPM 122 122
KCL % 2.50% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 44,0 38.0
%SOLIDS 9.1 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL 290.0 290
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DEscRrIPTION LENGTH - FT |[PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 {PDCBIT 1,00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 6" DRILL COLLARY 636.52 |sTROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 120 4233 21/2
GPM 380 5227 21/2
SURF PRESSURE 1500 6794 21/2
ECD 115 DAILY WELL COST $35,822
SLOW PUMP- SPM 55 JPREVIOUS CuM cosT $475,919
U:\PROD\DDRLGXLS BHA 673.03 |sLow PUMP-PRES | 680 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST 511,741




RO$<WOOD RESOURCES,-NC.

1600 BROADWAY, SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK February 27, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER CouNTY JsTate DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 9
[ TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs|cum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED  [LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
6794 20| 130.5 9.625 32.3 996' 9
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
CIRCULATE C.H.
REMARKS KB TO GL
AFTER SURE WE HAVE NO FLOW WILL PUMP ANOTHER SLUG AND TRIP OUT OF HOLE 16
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 07:00 | 1.00 [DRILLING FROM 6060 TO 6123 [ ROP 63]
7:00 | 08:00 | 1.00 |GO THOUGH BOTH PUMPS CHANGE 2 VALVES #1 AND SWAB IN #2
8:00 | 12:00 | 4.00 |DRILLING FROM 6123 TO 6280 [ROP 39]
12:00 | 12:30 | 0.50 [RIG SERVICE, B.O.P. DRILL FUNCTION ANNULAR ALL PERSONEL TO STATIONS WELL SECURED 3.5MIN
12:30 | 03:30 | 15.00 |DRILLING FROM 6280 TO 6794 [ROP 34 ] ***¥AST HOUR ROP DROP TO 10**¥¥#xk*
03:30 | 04:00 [ 0.50 |DROP SURVEY, PUMP DRY PIPE SLUG
04:00 | 06:00 | 2.00 |PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR ROP. [LAST 15 STANDS HOLE NOT TAKING MUD KELLY UP CIRCULATE ]
0P 164
DOWN 150
24.00 ROTATE 156
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 0:00 6155 NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1
TIME 10:30 107 SEAMUD SIZE 77/8
WEIGHT 10 2 BARACOR MFG HYCOLOG
VIS 40 49 POT.CHLORIDE |[TYPE 147
WL 6 IMPERMIX  seT 3-16 3-14
PV/YP 14@60 20 BARRITE SERIAL NO. 111321
H2S 2 WALLNUT DEPTH OUT
CA 100 DEPTH IN 996
GELS 4/9 TOTAL FEET 5798
ALK 1.2 HRS 130.5
pH 10@60 T/B/G
CAKE WT. ON BIT 18000
CL 31,000 DAILY COST $6,417.00 RPM 122
KCL % 3.10% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 44.0
%SOLIDS 8.6 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! ANVEL | 290.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 16" DRILL COLLARy 636.52 |sTROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 80 40 4233 ’ 21/2
GPM 250 250 5227 21/2
SURF PRESSURE 1900 1850
ECD 11.3 DAILY WELL COST $26,792
SLOW PUMP- SPM S0 |Previous cum cost $449,127
U:\PROD\DDRLG.XLS BHA 673.03 [sLow PuMP-PRES | 800 JCUMULATIVE WELL cOST }475,919




ROS./WNOOD RESOURCES, ~4C.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK February 26, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER [COUNTY ISTATE DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 8
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrsjcum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED  [LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
6060 23.5| 110.5 9.625 32.3 996' 8
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
DRILLING C.H.
REMARKS KB TO GL.
16
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 14:00 | 8.00 |DRILLING FROM 5280 TO 5482 [ROP 25]
14:00 | 14:30 { 0.50 [RIG SERVICE, FRUNCTION P.RAMS ALL PERSONEL TO STATIONS WELL SECURED 3MIN 45 SEC.
14:30 | 06:00 | 15.50 |DRILLING FROM 5482 TO 6060
UP 152
DOWN 142
24.00 ROTATE 146
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 0:00 NO. OF SACKS/LBS | PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1
TIME 9:00 5 BARA DEFOAM |SIZE 77/8
WEIGHT 9.8 60 BARRITE MFG HYCOLOG
VIS 42 8 CAUSTIC SODA |TYPE 147
WL 9 IMPERMIX JET 3-16 3-14
pv/YP 14 @ 60 13 SEAMUD SERIAL NO. 111321
H2s 11 POT. CHLORIDE |DEPTH OUT
CA 100 15 SAWDUST DEPTH IN 996
GELS 4/9 TOTAL FEET 5064
ALK 1.6 HRS 110.5
pH 10.5 T/B/G
CAKE WT. ON BIT 18000
CL 30,000 DAILY COST $4,383.00 RPM 122
KCL % 3.00% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP({fph) 45.0
%SOLIDS 8.7 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! ANVEL | 140.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO] BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 |6" DRILL COLLARY 636.52 |STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 80 40 4233 21/2
GPM 250 | 250 5227 212
SURF PRESSURE 1850
ECD 11.3 DAILY WELL COST $36,631
SLOW PUMP- SPM 56 JPrEVIOUS CUM CoST $412,496
U:\PROD\DDRLGXLS BHA 673.03 [sLow PUMP-PRES | 420 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $449,127




RG_EWOOD RESOURCES, dC.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADQ 80202
PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD [DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREFK February 25, 2006
[RIG NAME AND NUMBER [COUNTY lsrATE DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 7
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrsfcum Rot. Hrs {FOOTAGE DRILLED  JLAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
5280 21 87 9.625 32.3 996' 7
JACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
DRILLING C.H.
[REMARKS IKBTDGL
16
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail

06:00 | 10:30 | 4.50 |DRILLING FROM 4525 TO 4683

10:30 | 11:00 | 0.50 |RIG SERVICE, B.O.P. DRILL FUNCTION PIPE RAMS ALL PERSONEL TO STATIONS WELL SECURED3.5MIN
11:00 | 02:00 | 15.00 |DRILLING FROM 4683 TO 5227

2:00 | 02:30 | 0.50 |SURVEY [WIRE BROKE LOST SURVEY]

2:30 | 04:30 | 2.00 {TRIP FOR SURVEY [ 2 1/2 DEGREE]

4:30 | 06:00 1.50 |DRILLING FROM 5227 TO 5280 [MUD WEIGHT 9.8 ANY BELOW ALLOWS WATER FLOW]

UP
DOWN
24.00 ROTATE
R ———
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 0:00 NO. OF SACKS/LBS PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 1
TIME 12:00 60 SEA MUD SIZE 77/8
WEIGHT 10 49 POT. CHLORIDE |MFG HYCOLOG
VIS 45 9 CAUSTIC SODA [TYPE 147
WL 22 BARRITE JET 316 3-14
PV/YP 11@60 4 IMPERMIX SERIAL NO. 111321
H25 15 SAWDUST DEPTH OUT
CA 100 DEPTH IN 996
GELS ' TOTAL FEET 4284
ALK 1 HRS 87
pH 10.1 T/8/G
CAKE WT. ON BIT 18000
CL 39,000 DAILY COST $4,288.00 RPM 102
KCL % 3.90% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 50.2
%SOLIDS 8 CUMULATIVE C()i‘= |__ #REF! AN VEL 140.0
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 6" DRILL COLLARY 636.52 STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 120 4233 2172
GPM 352
SURF PRESSURE 1350
ECD 11.3 DAILY WELL COST $36,562
SLOW PUMP- SPM 55 JPREVIOUS CuM CosT $375,934
UAPROD\DDRLGXLS ~ BHA 673.03 |sLow PuMP- PRES | 600 JCUMULATIVE WELL. COST }412,496




FORM 3160-5 U "ED STATES
(Jane 1990) DEPARTM OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reenter a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

§. Lease Designation and Serial No.
UTU-73904

6. If indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE

1. Type of Well

on Gas
Well X Jwell

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
N/A

8. Well Name and No.

Lizard Creek 11-1

[over
2. Name of Operator

ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.

9. APl Well No.
43-047-36316

3. Address and Telephone No.
P.O. Box 1668, Vernal, UT 435-789-0414

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
Wildcat

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E 870" FNL 1293’ FWL

11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH CO., UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(es) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans
Recompletion New Construction
Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing
Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection
Other | Dispose Water
(Note: Report results of multiple compietion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed

work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see attached drilling reports on above mentioned well.
If you have any questions please feel free to call.
Thank you,

Jill Henrie

Rosewood Resources, Inc.
435-789-0414 x10

COPIES: ORIG. & 2-BLM; DIV. OG&M; DALLAS OFFICE

RECEIVED
MAR 09 2006

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. | hereby certlfy&at the, foregoing is true and correct

HU UMD

Signed

Title Administrative Assistant Date

03/08/06

(This space for Fede?a\){r State office use)
Approved by Title

Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and williully to make to any department or agency of the United States andy false, fictitious or fraudulent



ROSEW&OD RESOURCES, INC-

1600 BROADWAY, SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202

PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK March 7, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER [COUNTY ISI'ATE DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 17
[ TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrsjcum Rot. Hrs [FOOTAGE DRILLED  |LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET@ Report No.
8080 9.625 32.3 J-55 996' 17
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
RIG DOWN C.H.
REMARKS KB TO GL.
16
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 07:00 1.00 |NIPPLE DOWN PREPARE FOR SLIPS, CLEAN TANKS
7:00 08:00 | 1.00 [SET SLIPS WITH 70K AND CUT OFF CASING
8:00 16:00 | 10.00 |RIG DOWN. RIG RELEASED AT 18:00 HOURS
UP
WN
ROTATE
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. ITEM LENGTH
TIME 25 BARRITE SIZE SGUIDE SHOE 1.2 11/4
WEIGHT MFG SHOE JOINT 38.45
VIS TYPE FLOAT COLLAR 0.85
WL JET 12 JTS CSG 510.26
PV/YP SERJAL NO. 1ST MARKER 10.36
H2S DEPTH OUT 21 JTS CSG 892.32
CA DEPTH IN 2ND MARKER 10.28
GELS TOTAL FEET 37 JTS CSG 1572.45
ALK HRS 3RD MARKER 10.35
pH T/B/G 33 JTS CSG 1404.04
CAKE WT. ON BIT 4TH MARKER 10.34
cL DAILY COST $1,443.00 RPM 85 JTS CSG 3605.62
KCL % PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) FRATOTALX** 8066.6
%SOLIDS CUMULATIVE COST #REF! ANVEL _ [*DEPTH SET A 8062
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NoO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 4233 21/2
GPM 5227 21/2
SURF PRESSURE 8080 13/4
ECD DAILY WELL COST $31,655
SLOW PUMP- SPM IPREVIOUS CUM COST $1,214,671
J:\PROD\DDRLGXLS BHA 0.00 SLOW PUMP- PRES JCUMULATIVE WELL coST $1,246,326




ROSEWGOD RESOURCES, INC-

1600 BROADWAY, SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202

PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO, FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK March 6, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNTY ISTATE DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 16
ITOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrsjcum Rot. Hrs |FOOTAGE DRILLED [LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
8080 9.625 32.3 3-55 996' 16
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
C.H.
REMARKS KB TO GL.
NOTIFY STATE O&G=CAROLE. BLM MIKE, JAIMIE VOICE MAIL ON OFFICE, CELL, HOME NO RESPONS 16
[ TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 14:00 | 8.00 LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE, PULL WEAR RING,BREAK KELLY, LAY DOWN DRILL COLLARS
14:00 | 15:00 | 1.00 [RIG UP CASERS, HELD PRE JOB SAFETY MEETING, AND INSPECT EQUIPMENT
15:00 | 20:30 | 5.50 [RUN CASING. SHOE LENGTH 1.25 SET AT 8062, 1STMARKER SET AT 7515.76,
2NDMARKER SET AT 6613.08, 3RD MARKER SET AT 5030.35, 4THMARKER SET AT 3615.96
**CASING DETAILS BELOW IN BIT RECORD** 14 EXTRA JOINTS LEFT OUT**STRING WEIGHT 82k***
20:30 | 23:30 | 3.00 |CIRCULATE GAS OUT & CONDITION MUD FOR CEMENT,RU HALLIBURTON,HELD PreJobSafetyMeeting |
23:30 | 02:00 | 2.50 jPRESSURE TEST SURFACE LINES TO 3000 psi PUMP 20 BBL SUPER FLUSH, LEAD CEMENT 215 SX
10% EXCESS ADDITIVES= HIFILL"V" 16% GEL,1%EX-1,3% SALT .2% HR-7, 10# GILSONITE
25#SX FLOCELE.  TAIL CEMENT 1025SX 10% EXESS ADDITIVES=50/50 POZ "G" 2% GEL
3%KCL,.75% HALAD-322,.2%HR-5,.25#FLOCELE, | #GRANULITE, 3# SX SILICATE .2% FWCA
LIFT PRESSURE 2520 BUMPED PLUG WITH 500PSI OVER PLUG & FLOATS HELD PLUG DOWN 01:30
CALCULATED TOP OF CEMENT LEAD=996 CALCULATED TOP OF CEMENT TAIL=3400
OBSERVE ANNULAS & CEMENT LINE 15 MINUTES RIG DOWN HALLIBURTON
02:00 | 06:00 | 4.00 |NIPPLE DOWN B.O.P. AND PREPARE CELLAR FOR SLIPS
UP
DOWN
24.00 ROTATE
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8080 PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. ITEM LENGTH
TIME 11:09 220 barrite SIZE GUIDE SHOE 1.24 11/4
WEIGHT 10.1 60 SAW DUST  |MFG SHOE JOINT 38.45
VIS 63 27 CEDAR FIBER |TYPE FLOAT COLLAR 0.85
WL 3 ZEO GEL JET 12 JTS CSG 510.26
PV/YP 13 SERIAL NO. 1ST MARKER 10.36
H2S DEPTH OUT 21 JTS CSG 892.32
CA 120 DEPTH IN 2ND MARKER 10.28
IGELS 9/16 TOTAL FEET 37 JTS CSG 1572.45
ALK 0.7 HRS 3RD MARKER 10.35
pH 9.6 T/B/G 33 JTS CSG 1404.04
CAKE WT. ON BIT 4TH MARKER 10.34
cL 21,000 DAILY COST $10,668.00 [rRPM 85 JTS CSG 3605.62
KCL % 2.10% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) FXITOTALX** 8066.6
%SOLIDS 10.4 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL *DEPTH SET ATH 8062
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 BIT SUB 2.73 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 |6" DRILL COLLARY 636.52 |STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 120 4233 21/2
GPM 380 5227 21/2
SURF PRESSURE 1800 8080 13/4
ECD 11.6 DAILY WELL COST $231,582
SLOW PUMP- SPM 52 JprEVIOUS CuM cosT $983,089
U:\PROD\DDRLGXLS  BHA 640.25 [SLOW PUMP-PRES | 745 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $1,214,671




ROS=-WOOD RESOURCES, =dC.

1600 BROADWAY, SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202

PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK March 5, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER COUNTY [state DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH | 15
[TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrs|cum Rot. Hrs {FOOTAGE DRILLED  |LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
8080 9.625 32.3 J-55 996' l 15
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
PUMP DRY PIPE SLUG C.H.
REMARKS KB TO GL.
NOTIFY STATE O&G=CAROLE. BLM MIKE, JAIMIE VOICE MAIL ON OFFICE, CELL, HOME NO RESPONS] 16
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 07:00 1.00 {RIG DOWN HALLIBURTON LOGERS **WELL FLOWING**
7:00 09:30 2.50 |RUN IN HOLE TO 2788 SHUT IN WELL OBTAIN PRESSURES OPEN CHOKE TO GAS BUSTER
9:30 12:30 | 3.00 {CIRCULATE AND CONDITION GAS OUT AND KILL WATER FLOW
12:30 | 13:30 1.00 {PULL OUT OF HOLE.
13:30 | 18:00 | 4.50 |JRUN IN HOLE TO 8080 *xkxHAD 30 FOOT FLARE****
18:00 | 06:00 | 0.50 |CIRCULATE GAS OUT, AND SWEEP AROUND, [WORK ON FORKLIFT] RIG UP CASERS ,PUMP SLUG
*¥RIG READY AT 20:00, UNABLE TO TO RUN FORKLIFT TILL 04:30=8 1/2 HOURS**
UP 180
DOWN 160
12.50 ROTATE 170
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8080 PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 2 3
TIME 75 barrite SIZE 77/8 77/8
WEIGHT 10.2 18 wall nut MFG HYCOLOG HYCOLOG
VIS 69 21 sea mud TYPE DSX-146 275
WL 2 sapp JET 3-13 3-18 4-12 4-18
PV/YP 16 4 caustic soda  |SERIAL NO. 103515 109576
H2S 10 sawdust DEPTH OUT 7580 8080
CA 120 2 lime DEPTH IN 6794 7580
GELS 11/22 1 zeo gel TOTAL FEET 786 500
ALK 0.8 HRS 23.5 38.00
pH 9.7 T/B/G 8- N/A-1
CAKE WT. ON BIT 20000 15K-30K
cL DAILY COST $14,302.00 |rRPM 102 102
KCL % 2.10% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 33.4 13.1
%SOLIDS 11.8 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL 140.0 140
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 BIT SUB 2.73 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 16" DRILL COLLARy 636.52 |[STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 120 4233 21/2
GPM 380 5227 21/2
SURF PRESSURE 1800 8080 13/4
ECD 11.6 DAILY WELL COST $65,672
SLOW PUMP- SPM 52 Ipaevmus CUM COST $917,417
U:\PROD\DDRLGXLS BHA 640.25 |SLOW PUMP-PRES | 745 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $983,089




' ROS=WOOD RESOURCES, =nC.

1600 BROADWAY,SUITE 2400
DENVER, COLORADO 80202

PHONE 303-877-4670
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
LEASE NAME & WELL NO. FIELD DATE
LIZARD CREEK 11-1 BITTER CREEK March 4, 2006
RIG NAME AND NUMBER [COUNTY ISTATE DAY NO.
PATTERSON #77 UINTAH , UTAH 14
TOTAL DEPTH Rot. Hrsjcum Rot. Hrs [FOOTAGE DRILLED  {LAST CASING SIZE, WEIGHT, GRADE SET @ Report No.
8080 3 192 9.625 32.3 J-55 996' 14
ACTIVITY AT REPORT TIME REPORTED BY
RUN LOGS C.H.
REMARKS KB TO GL.
16
TIME LOG
FROM TO HOURS Activity Detail
06:00 | 09:00 3,00 |DRILLING FROM 8065 TO 8080 [ ROP 5] **TOTAL DEPTH 8080 **
9:00 10:00 1.00 |SHORT TRIP OUT TO 7150 & IN TO 8080
10:00 | 12:30 2.50 |CIRCULATE SWEEP TO SURFACE, DROP SURVEY, PUMP DRY PIPE SLUG **SURVEY@ T.D.=1 3/4degree,
12:30 | 20:00 7.50 |PULL QUT OF HOLE, STEEL LINE MEASURMENT=8067
20:00 | 06:00 | 10.00 [RIG UP HALCO. 1ST RUN HI.RES INDUCTION **SURFACE CASING 1006 LOGER T.D. 8066**
2ND RUN NETRON DENSITY MICRO LOG WITH GAMMA RAY
UP 180
DOWN 160
24.00 ROTATE 170
MUD RECORD MUD MATERIALS USED BIT RECORD
DEPTH 8080 PRODUCT NAME BIT NO. 2 3
TIME 75 barrite SIZE 7 7/8 77/8
WEIGHT 10.2 18 wall nut MFG HYCOLOG HYCOLOG
VIS 47 21 sea mud TYPE DSX-146 275
WL 2 sapp JET 3-13 3-18 4-12 4-18
PV/YP 12 4 caustic soda  [SERIAL NO. 103515 109576
H2S 10 sawdust DEPTH OUT 7580 8080
CA 120 2 lime DEPTH IN 6794 7580
GELS 7/16 1 zeo gel TOTAL FEET 786 500
ALK 1.1 HRS 23.5 38.00
pH 10.1 T/B/G 8- N/A-1
CAKE WT. ON BIT 20000 15K-30K
a 24,000 DAILY COST $4,144.00  [rPM 102 102
KCL % 2.40% PREVIOUS COST #REF! ROP(fph) 33.4 13.1
%SOLIDS 10.2 CUMULATIVE COST #REF! AN VEL 140.0 140
DRILLING ASSEMBLY PUMP DATA DEVIATION RECORD
NO. | DESCRIPTION LENGTH - FT |[PUMP NO. 1 2 DEPTH INCLINATION
1 PDC BIT 1.00 MAKE EMSCO| BREW 1200 1/4
1 MUD MOTER 35.51 MODEL F800 | B-750 1711 1/4
21 |6" DRILL COLLARY 636.52 |[STROKE 8.0 16 2737 1/2
LINER SIZE 6.0 5.5 3249 1
SPM 120 4233 21/2
GPM 380 5227 21/2
SURF PRESSURE 1800 6794 21/2
ECD 11.6 DAILY WELL COST $43,577
SLOW PUMP- SPM 52 JprEVIOUS CUM COST $873,840
U:\PROD\DDRLG.XLS BHA 673.03 |sLow PUMP-PRES | 745 JCUMULATIVE WELL COST $917,417




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 7

REPORT OF WATER ENCOUNTERED DURING DRILLING

Well name and number: L [ AV&_C_»««.\( -1
APi number: t—l}-o‘i}- 36}16
Well Locstion: QQ Wgw Section [l Townsnip {13 Range 2ZZ£ County _iw to h

Well operator: wii-1.]
Address: PO. Box | (A Xe)
ay Vernal  sue UTzp 94078  phone: 435 - 789 - oY1y

Drilling contractor: ?q ‘H‘c vSowvn,

Address: _,M

m_é_»\}dnr_mmo Phone: 328 — 549~ 6300

Water encountered (attach additional pages as needed):

DEPTH VOLUME QUALITY
FROM TO (FLOW RATE OR HEAD) (FRESH OR SALTY)
1800 | 2200 30 6PM Fresh

qt?*\\&i“. K';“

Formation tops: 1 WA&‘N‘\"\'\ -3192. 2 ML.% v""a" ° SZ’Z— 3 Mmf"ﬂg - 7’5 3
(Top to Botiom) 4 5 6
7 8 8
10 11 12

if an analysis has been made of the water encountered, please attach a copy of the report to this form.

| hereby cerstify that this report Is true and compiste to the best of my knowledge.

NAME (PLEASE PHINT) ~JoN HCV‘ hs\{' T S“‘ G"QO l e 'Li

s+

SIGNATURE oaTE j - ‘o -— 0,62
w2000} !
| Accepted by the RECEIVED
Utah Division of MAR 13 2006

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY DIV,

OF OIL, GAS & MINING



FORM.3160s6 ' TED STATES
(June 1990) DEPARTNENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for propasals to drill or to deepen or reenter a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.
UTU-73904

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well
Onl Gas
Well X well Other

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
N/A

8. Well Name and No.

Lizard Creek 11-1

2. Name of Operator
ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.

9. API Well No.
43-047-36316

3. Address and Telephone No.
P.O. Box 1668, Vernal, UT 435-789-0414

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
Wildcat

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E  870' FNL 1293' FWL

11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH CO., UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(es) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans
Recompletion | New Construction
Subsequent Report Piugging Back | Non-Routine Fracturing
| Casing Repair Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

X | Other Site Security Diagram Dispose Water

(Note: Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed
work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Please see attached site security diagram on above mentioned well.
If you have any questions please feel free to call.

Thank you, Accepted by the
Utah Division of
Jill Henrie Oil, Gas and Mining

Rosewood Resources, Inc.
435-789-0414 x10

FOR RECORD ONLY

COPIES: ORIG. & 2-BLM; DIV. OG&M; DALLAS OFFICE
14. | hereby cer;tify ;at the foregoing is true and correct
A v@r’\\ﬂ W]

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:

Signed Title Administrative Assistant Date 03/09/06

RECEIVED

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States an false, fictiti dQle
gency u MAR 137006

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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Wellhead
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Water Tank
310 BBLS

Oil Tank
310 BBLS

 Sales Valve Sales Valve

Lizard Creek 11-1

NWNW SEC 11 T11SR22E
Rosewood Resources, Inc.



UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM 3160-5
(June 1980)

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reenter a different reservoir.

Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT -" for such proposals

FORM APPROVED
Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

UTU-73904

6. If indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE
1. Type of Well »
\(I)V“ell X \(I’;/aesll D Other . a o :y' i_

7. if Unit or CA, Agreement Designation
N/A

8. Well Name and No.

Lizard Creek 11-1

2. Name of Operator
ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC.

9. AP1 Well No.
43-047-36316

3. Address and Telephone No.
P.O. Box 1668, Vernal, UT 435-789-0414

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
Wildcat

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E 870" FNL 1293' FWL

11. County or Parish, State

UINTAH CO., UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(es) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D Notice of Intent | Abandonment : Change of Plans
| Recompletion X | New Construction
Subsequent Report Plugging Back | Non-Routine Fracturing
| Casing Repair | Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice : Altering Casing : Conversion to Injection
Other Dispose Water
T (Note: Report results of multiple completiom Weill
Compietion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed
work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

See attached completion reports. Please call w/ any concerns.
Thank You

Jill Henrie

Rosewood Resources, Inc.

435-789-0414 x10

COPIES: ORIG. & 2-BLM; DIV. OG&M; DALLAS OFFICE

‘' RECEIVED

DIV.OF 01l CAS & Minahi

05/05/06

14. | hereby certif e f rT—\omg is true and correct
Signed Tite Administrative Assistant Date

(This space for Fede | or gtate office use)
Approved by Title

Date

Conditions of approval, if any:

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knawingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States andy false, fictitious or fraudulent



DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

LEASE: WELL NO: LOCATION: COUNTY: STATE:
Wildcat 111 Lizard Creek Uintah Utah
PBTD: |Form Perfs: Tbyg: PKR: Csg: Liner: CONTRACTOR: e y, .
8030 412" 11.6# 8062 Duco Inc. Rig #3
COMP. DAYS: Today's Operation:
1 MIRU
Yesterdays Operations
Hr SITP: Hr. SICP: FL@: Dally Load Rec Bbls: [Accum Load Rec Bbis: Accum Total Load Bbls:
1:30 MIRU
7:00 SIFN
Thg Csg Meter or Prover Flow Swab F.L Remarks: % Oli/Cond
Time Choke {Press Press Press |Diff |Orifice Mcfd Tank Gauge |Bbis AM/PM__ [Gravity, Est. Fid, pH, etc.
CODE _ Cost Detall Daily Cumulative  Code Cost Detall Daily Cumulative
Locatlon & Roads Casing
Rig $2,500.00 $2,900.00 Tubing
Downhole Equlpmen Wellhead
Water Production Equipment
Tanks
Supervision $1,000.00 $1,000.00
BOP Rentat
W.L. Services
Trucking
Treatment
Surface Equip Renta
Cement DAILY COST $3,900.00 $3,900.00
CUM. COMPLETION COST $3,800.00 - R E C E 'VE D
DRLG/CONST COST $1,246,326.00
TOTAL CUM COST $1,250,226.00 pre ._‘, RNt
WELL SITE REPRESENTATIVE Date Water on Location Tanks on Location L 4
Leland Evans 4/25/2006

DIV. OF OIL. GAS & MINING



DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

LEASE: WELL NO: LOCATION: COUNTY: STATE:
Wiidcat 11-1 Lizard Creek Uintah Utah
PBTD: |Form Perfs: Tbg: PKR: Csg: Liner: CONTRACTOR:
8030 7650'-52° 7591' - 246 jis 7595 41/2'M-8011.6# 8062 Duco Inc. Rig #3
COMP. DAYS: Today's Operation:
2 Perf, TIH W/ Pir picking up TBG, Break perfs down, swab.
Yesterdays Operations MIRU
Hr SITP: Hr. SICP: F.L @®: Daily Load Rec Bbls: [Accum Load Rec Bbis: |Accum Total Load Bbls:
0 Surface
7:00 ND Wellhead, NU Weatherford 7 1/16" x 5000# BOP 2 3/8 rams.
8:00 RU Weatherford wireline, RIH w/ 3 1/8" slick guns, perf 7700 - 7704' 35 PF, perf 7650' - 7652' 35 PF RD Wireline.
10:30 RU Wesatherford 4 1/2 type HD pks. 2 3/8" x 1780 SN TiH picking up 2 3/8" thg to 7595 KB (218 jts) Set pkr.
[4:30 _RU pump broke zone down @ 3650 PSi pump S bbis @ 2 BPM @ 2800 # ISIP 1900#.
5:30 RU swab. Fiuid @ surface swab 27 1/2 bbis in 4 runs. Fluid level @ 4200 (little gas)
6:30_ SWIFN
Thg Csg Meter or Prover Flow Swab F.L Remarks: % Oi/Cond
Time |[Choke |Press Press Press |Diff | Orifice Mecfd Tank Gauge |Bbls AM/PM__|Gravity, Est. Fid, pH, etc.
CODE__ Cost Datail Daily Cumuiative  Code Cost Detait Daily Cumulative
Location & Roads Casing
Rig $6,100.00 $9,000.00 Tubing
Downhole Equipmer] $2,500.00 $2,500.00 Wellhead
Water Production Equipment
Tanks
Supervision $1,000.00 $2,000.00
BOP Rental $350.00 $350.00
W.L. Services $4,036.00 $4,036.00
Trucking
Treatment
Surface Equip Ren%
Cament DAILY COST $13,986.00 $17,886.00
CUM. COMPLETION COST] $17,886.00 R EC E l VE D
DRLG/CONST COST §1,246,326.00
TOTAL CUM COST $1,264,212.00 b °_*~ir' f ) ) :‘ o ':
WELL SITE REPRESENTATIVE Date Water on Location Tanks on Location

Leland Evans 42612006 100 Rig Tank 250 DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

LEASE: WELL NO: [LOCATION: COUNTY: STATE:
Wildcat 11-1 Lizard Creek Uintah Utah
PBTD: |Form Perfs: Thg: PKR: Csg: Liner: CONTRACTOR:
8030 23/8 7591 7595' 41/2'M-8011.6# 8062 Duco Inc. Rig #3
COMP. DAYS: Today's Operation:
3 Swab test Castlegate
Yesterdays Operations Perf Castlegate. PU TBG
Hr SITP: Hr. SICP: FL. @: Daily Load Rec Bbis: [Accum Load Rec Bbls: [Accum Total Load Bbis:
12 1/271420 14/ 0 35172
7:00 SITP 420# Blow TBG down.
7:30 RIH & swab. Fluid level @ 5200'. Swab 7 3/4 BBLS in 2 runs. (TTL of 35 1/4). Make 1 dry run.
8:30-9:30  Make 1 run. No fluid.
9:30-10:30  SWI build to 30 PSI
10:30-12:00 RIH w/ swab. Recovered 1/4 BBL (Total Fluid recovered 35 1/2 BBLS)
12:00-1:00 RIH w/ swab to 7590". No fiuid.
1:00-5:00 Released PKR. TOOH. LD PKR. Prep to frac.
5:00 SWIFN
Thg Csg Meter or Prover Flow Swab F.L Remarks: % Oil/Cond
Time {Choke |Press Press Press |Diff .|Orifice Mecfd Tank Gauge {Bbls AM/PM |Gravity, Est. Fid, pH, etc.
CODE  Cost Detail Daily Cumuiative Code Cost Detail Daily Cumulative
Location & Roads Casing
Rig $5,400.00 $14,400.00 Tubing
Downhole Equipme $2,500.00 Wellhead
Water $7,500.00 $7,500.00 Production Equipment
Tanks
Supervision $1,000.00 $3,000.00
BOP Rental $350.00 $700.00
W.L. Services $4,036.00
Trucking $9,085.00 $9,085.00
Treatment
Surface Equip Ren
Cement DAILY COST $23,335.00 $41,221.00
CUM. COMPLETION COST $41,221.00
DRLG/CONST COST $1,246,326.00
TOTAL CUM COST $1,287,547.00
WELL SITE REPRESENTATIVE Date Water on Location Tanks on Location
Leland Evans 4/27/2006 100 Rig Tank 3-500

RECEIVED

[
; A S
{

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



RECEIVED

4
t

DIV. OF OlL, GAS & MINING



DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

LEASE: WELL NO: LOCATION: COUNTY: STATE:
Wildcat 11-1 Lizard Creek Uintah Utah
PBTD: |Form Perfs: Tbg: PKR: Csg: Liner: CONTRACTOR:

8030 41/2"M-8011.6# 8062 Duco Inc. Rig #3
COMP. DAYS: Today's Operation:

4 Perf and Frac
Yesterdays Operations Petf Castlegate. PU TBG
Hr SITP: Hr. SICP: F.L @: Daily Load Rec Bbis: {Accum Load Rec Bbls: Accum Total Load Bbis:
14 hr S| = 140 psig

07:00 Rig up Black Warrior Wireline. RIH & perforate Stage 2 (Mesaverde) 7552-7557, 7544-7550 (Perf Only) RIH set CFP @ 7520. Perforate
rest of Stage 2 (Mesaverde) 7489-7491, 7474-7476. Rigdown wireline equipment.

10:30 Rig up Stinger. Rig up Halliburton frac equipment.

11:30 Pressure test. Have safety meeting. Frac Mesaverde Stage 2 (7474-7476, 7489-7491). Broke @ 5 bpm & 4356 psi. Ave rate = 22.3 bpm,
Max rate = 25.9 bpm, Ave Treating pressure = 4522 psi, Max treating pressure = 4896 psi. 54 Tons Downhole, 4 Tons Cool down. 10,987 gallons
fluid, 35,110 #'s 20/40 Ottawa Sand. ISIP = 2792 psi, Frac Gradient = 0.81 psifft.

14:00 Rig up BWWireline. RiH and set flow through CBP @ 7380. Perforate Stage 3, 7309-7311, 7288-7292, 7247-7249, 7206-7208 w/ 3 SPF,
120 Deg phasing, 25 grams, 0.420 holes, 50.69 Penetration. Rig up Halliburton and frac Stage 3 w/ 70 quality foam. Broke @ 16 bpm & 6060 psi.
Ave rate = 28.8 bpm, Ave pressure = 5514 psi, Max rate = 38 bpm, Max slurry rate = 16.2 bpm, Max CO2 rate = 23.9 bpm, Total fluid = 18,381 gal.

Total sand 88,307 #'s 20/40 Ottawa. ISIP = 2764 psi. Frac Gradient = 0.82 psi/fft. CO2 Used = 124 Tons + 5 Tons for cool down..
Rig up BWWireline. Set flow through CBP @ 7090. Perforate Stage 4 (Mesaverde) 7019-7021, 7008-7010, 6914-6916, 6870-6876 w/ 3 SPF, 120
deg phasing, 25 gram, 0.420 holes, 50.68 Penetration. Frac Stage 4 w/ 70 quality foam. Broke @ 10.8 bpm & 4654 psi. Ave rate = 29.9 bpm.

Ave slurry rate = 12.6 bpm. Ave CO2 rate = 16.5 bpm. Max pressure = 6080 psi. Max rate = 33.5 bpm. Max slurry rate = 14.3 bpm. Max CO2 rate

= 20.6 bpm. Total fluid = 19,645 gallons. Total sand = 100,895 #'s 20/40 Ottawa. ISIP = 3131 psi. Frac Gradient = 0.89 psi/ft. Start flow back at

8 pm on an 18/64 choke & 2600 psi. Total load to recover is 1258 bbls.

Tbg Csg Meter or Prover Flow Swab F.L Remarks: % Oil/iCond
Time Choke  [Press Press Press |Diff  |Orifice Mcfd Tank Gauge {Bbis AM/PM__ |Gravity, Est. Fid, pH, etc.
CODE __ Cost Detall Daily Cumulative Code Cost Detail Daily Cumulative
Location & Roads Casing
Rig $4,831.00/  $19.231.00 Tubing _
Downhole Equipmen $2,500.00 Wellhead
Water $7,500.00 Production Equipment
Tanks $300.00 $300.00 Hot Oil Truck $2,800.00 $2,800.00
Supervision $1,000.00 $4,000.00 Roustabout $2,600.00 $2,600.00
BOP Rental $350.00 $1,050.00 HES Frac Plugs $6,600.00 $6,600.00
W.L. Services $25,087.00 $29,123.00
Truckinl $9,085.00
Treatment
Surface Equip Renta}
Cement DAILY COST $43,568.00 $84,789.00
CUM. COMPLETION COST $84,789.00
DRLG/CONST COST $1,246,326.00
TOTAL CYM POSR r~ 13y 71— $1,331,115.00
WELL SITE REPRESENTATIVE Date Water on Location MU LIvVEL Tanks on Location
Russell Evans 4/28/2006 7000 Gal N 3-500

£

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



BECEIVED

A N
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT B
LEASE: WELLNO:  [LOCATION: COUNTY: stare:  DIV. OF Qil], GAS & MINING
Wildcat 1141 Lizard Creek Uintah Utah
PBTD: |Form Perfs: Thyg: PKR: Csg: Liner: CONTRACTOR:
8030 41/2" M-8011.6 # B062' Duco Inc. Rig #3
COMP. DAYS: Today's Operation:
5 Perf and Frac Stage 5. Flow back stages 1-5 (6470-7704) (1175 bbls left to recover)
Yesterdays Operations Perf Castlegate. PU TBG
Hr SITP: Hr. SICP: FL @: Daily Load Rec Bbls: |Accum Load Rec Bbls: Accum Total Load Bbls:

8 PM to 7 AM Flow back stages 1-4 (6870-7704). FCP = 2000 psi on 18/64" choke. Recovered 480 bbls in 11 hrs. Ave of 43.6 bph. 777 bbis left to
recover. Well flowing heavy mist and CO2 foam. Shut well in at 7 AM. Rig up BWWireline and pik up 4 1/2" fiow through CBP and 3 1/8" expendable
perforating guns. RIH to correlate to short joint. Set flow through plug at 6820. Perforate Stage 5 (Mesaverde) @ 6744-6745, 6690-6692, 6470-6472

w/ 3 spf, 120 deg phasing, 25 gram shot, 0.420 holes, 50.69 penetration.

08:30 AM Rig up Stinger wellhead protection and Halliburton. Pressure test. Have safety meeting.

10:30 AM Frac Stage 5 (6470-6745) w/ 70 quality foam. Broke @ 12.1 bpm & 4120 psi. Ave rate = 21.9 bpm. Ave slurry rate = 10.3 bpm. Ave CO2

rate = 10.9 bpm. Ave pressure = 4562 psi. Max rate = 29.1 bpm. Max slurry rate = 12 bpm. Max CO2 rate = 19.9 bpm. Max pressure = 6370 psi.
Max pressure was set at 6200 psi but trucks didn't kick out until 6370 psi. Total fluid pumped = 16,671 bbls. Totai Foam pumped = 50,881 gallons.
CO2 downhole = 98 tons. CO2 Cooldown = 5 tons. Sand in formation = 93,622 #'s 20/40 Ottawa. ISIP = 2265 psi. FG = 0.78 psifft.

11:30 AM Start flowback Stages 1-5 (6470-7704) on 18/64" choke & 1800 psi. Load to recover = 1175 bbls.

Tbg Csg Meter or Prover Flow Swab F.L Remarks: % Oit/Cond
Time Choke Press Press Press |Diff  |Orifice Mcfd Tank Gauge |[Bbls AM/PM _ |Gravity, Est. Fid, pH, etc.
07:00A | 18/64 2000
11:30A] 18/64 1800

CODE __ Cost Detail Daily Cumuiative Code Cost Detail Daily Cumulative
Location & Roads Casing
Rig $3,050.00 $22,281.00 Tubing
Downhole Equipme $2,500.00 Weilhead
Water $3,500.00 $11,000.00 Production Equipment
Tanks $150.00 $450.00 Hot Oli Truck $1,800.00 $4,600.00
Supervision $1,000.00 $5,000.00 Roustabout $2,600.00
BOP Rental $350.00 $1,400.00 HES Frac Plugs $2,200.00 $8,800.00
W.L. Services $10,035.00 $39,158.00 Stinger Wellhead Service $11,993.10 $11,983.10
Trucking $9,085.00 Praxair CO2 Stage 2.6 $158,610.00 $158,610.00
Treatment Halliburton Fracing $263,837.00 $253,837.00
Surface Equip Rental
Cement DAILY COST $446,525.10 $531,314.10
CUM. COMPLETION COST $531,314.10
DRLG/CONST COST $1,246,326.00
TOTAL CUM COST $1,777,640.10
WELL SITE REPRESENTATIVE Date Water on Location Tanks on Location

Russell Evans 4/29/2006 7000 Gal 3-500




RECEIVED

DAILY COMPLETION REPORT Passr o .
R R )
LEASE: WELL NO:  |LOCATION: COUNTY: STATE:
Wildcat 11-1__|Lizard Creek Uintah utah ___DIV. OF OfL. GAS & MINING
PBTD: {Form Parfs: Thg: PKR: Csg: Liner: CONTRACTOR:
8030 6470-7704 41/2" M-80 11.6 # 8062 Duco Inc. Rig #3
COMP. DAYS: Today’s Operation:
6 Flow back stages 1.5
Yesterdays Operations : Flow steps 1-4 Perf & Frac stage 5 Flow back stages 1-5
Hr SITP: Hr. SICP: FL @: Dally Load Rec Bbis:|Accum Load Rec Bbls: [Aceum Total Load Bbls:
4/29
11:30 A.M. _ Start flow back stages 1-5. 1800 PS! on 18/64" choke.
1:00-5:00 _ 1800 PSI on 18/64" choke. Heavy sand. Heavy mist. Rec 10 SKS sand. 895 BBLS Ieft to recover. Avg 43 BBLS per hour.
5:00 - 12:00 1700 PSI on 18/64" choke. No sand. Hvy mist. 615 left to recover.
4/30
12:00 - 7:00 1700 PSI on 18/64" choke. Heavy mist. 335 left to recover. 840 BBLS Total recovery.
7:00 - 12:00 Flow back stages 1-5 on 18/64" choke @ 1700 PS|. Recovered 130 BBLS. Total recovery 970 BBLS. 205 Left to recover. CO2 @
26 degrees 20 AVG BBLS per hour. Bumable gas.
12:00 - 5:00 Fiow back stages 1-5 on 18/64" choke @ 1600 PSI. Recavered 105 BBLS. Total recovery 1075 BBELS. 100 BBLS left to recover.
CO2 @ 20 degrees. AVG BBLS 20 per hour. Bumable gas.
Load 1175 BBLS
Thbg Csg Meter or Prover Flow Swab F.L Remarks: % Oil/Cond
Time |Choke |Press [Press  |Press |Diff |Orifice Mcfd Tank Gauge |Bbls AM/PM [Gravity, Est. Fid, pH, etc.|
12:00] 18/64 1700 615 BBLS 560 left 43 BPH _{Sand
7:00] 18/64 1700 840 BBLS 335 left 40 BPH __|No sand, hvy mist
12:00] 18/64 1700 970 BBLS 205 left 20 BPH _ |Hvy mist CO2 20 degrees
5:00{ 18/64 1600 1070 BBLS 100 left 20 BPH _ |Hvy mist CO2 20 degrees
CODE __ Cost Detail Daily Cumulative  Code Cost Detall Daily Cumulative
Location & Roads Casing
Rig $22,281.00 Tubing
Downhole Equipme $2,500.00 Wellhead
Water $11,000.00 Production Equipment
Tanks $150.00 $600.00 Hot Oil Truck $4,600.00
Supervision $1,000.00 $6,000.00 Roustabout $2,600.00
BOP Rental $350.00 $1.750.00 HES Frac Plugs $8,800.00
W.L. Services $39,158.00 Stinger Wellhead Service $11,893.10
Trucking $9,085.00 Praxair CO2 Stage 2-5 $158,610.00
Treatment Halliburton Fracing $253,837.00
Surface Equip Ren Flow testers $4,500.00 $4,500.00
Cement DAILY COST $6,000.00
CUM. COMPLETION COST] $537,314.10
DRLG/CONST COST $1,246,326.00
TOTAL CUM COST $1,783,640.10
WELL SITE REPRESENTATIVE Date Water on Location Tanks on Location
Russell Evans 4/30/20086 150 BBLS 3500




RECEIVED
A

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MININT



330

1175

170 BBLS over 7 A.M. 5/1/06

DAILY COMPLETION REPORT .
i
LEASE: WELL NO: |LOCATION: COUNTY: STATE:
Wildcat 111 Lizard Creek Uintah Utah DIV Ne
PBTD: |Form Perfs: Thg: PKR: Csg: Liner: CONTRACTOR:
8030 41/2" M-B0 11.6 # 8062 Duco Inc. Rig #3
COMP. DAYS: Today’s Operation:
7 Set kill piug. Drill pugs at 6390' 6820
Yesterdays Operations : Fiow back stages 1-5
Hr SITP: Hr. SICP: FL @: Daily Load Rec Bbis:|Accum Load Rec Bbis:  [Accum Total Load Bbis:

12:00-7:00  Flow back stages 1-5 20/64" choke @ 1300 PSI. Recovered 170 BBLS overload 5 degrees CO2 AVG 20 BPH.

8:00 RU Black Warrior Wireline. RIH w/ solid CP. Set @ 6390' RD wireline.

10:00 PU 3 7/8 smith bit. Weatherford pump off sub. 1 jt SN. TiH to 6390’

2:00 PU Weatherford swivel. RU Weatherford foam unit. Pressure well up to 1200 PS! (foam unit lost drive ling) Change out flow lines
3:00-5:00  Change out drive fine on foam unit.

5:00 Drilt kill plug out. TiH to plug & 6820' Drill plug out, clean hole. SWIFN Bit @ 6840 (222 its)

Drill plugs 1200 SCFM. 1100 PSI on TBG. 950 PSI on CSG 38/64" choke. Pumped 50 BBLS. Recovered 150 BBLS. 270 BBLS over load.

Load 1175 BBLS

si

Thy Csg Meter or Prover IFIow Swab Remarks: % Oil/Cond
Time |[Choke |[Press Press Press |DHY  |Orifice Mcfd Tank Gauge |Bbls Gravity, Est. Fid, pH, etc.
CODE _ Cost Detail Dally Cumuiative  Code Cost Detail Daily Cumulative
Location & Roads Casing
Rig $5,811.00]  $28,092.00 Tubing
Downhole Equipme $11,500.00 $14,000.00 Wellhead
Water $11,000.00 Roustabout $1,000.00 $1,000.00
Tanks $150.00 $750.00 Hot Oil Truck $4,600.00
Supervision $1,000.00 $7,000.00 Roustabout $2,600.00
BOP Rental $350.00 $2,100.00 HES Frac Plugs $8,800.00
W.L. Services $6,800.00 $45,958.00 Stinger Wellhead Service $11,993.10
Trucking $9,085.00 Praxair CO2 Stage 2-5 $158,610.00
Treatment Halliburton Fracing $253,837.00
Surface Equip Rent{ Flow testers $1,500.00 $6,000.00
Cement DAILY COST $28,111.00
CUM. COMPLETION COST $565,425.10
DRLG/CONST COST $1,246,326.00
TOTAL CUM COST $1,811,751.10
WELL SITE REPRESENTATIVE Date Water on Location Tanks on Location
Russell Evans 5/1/2006 150 BBLS 3-500
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RECEIVED

DAILY COMPLETION REPORT b Voo
TR - )
LEASE: WELL NO: LOCATION: COUNTY: STATE:
Wildcat 111 |Lizard Creek Uintah ueh DIV OF OIl, GAS & MINING
PBTD: |Form Perfs: Thg: PKR: Csg: Liner: CONTRACTOR:
8030' 41/2"M-80 11.6# 8062 Duco Inc. Rig #3
COMP. DAYS: Today's Operation:
8 Drill Plugs
Yesterdays Operations : Kill plug. Drill plugs.
Hr SITP: Hr. SICP: FL @: Daily Load Rec Bbis: JAccum Load Rec Bbis: jAccum Total Load Bbis:
11172 1100 11172 2100 over 270
7:00 _Blow CSG down. TiH to plug @ 7090 Drill plug J out @ 7090". TiH to 7365". Tag sand. Ciean out to plug @ 7380 Drill plug out @ 7380". lay 30
TiH to 7510'. Tag sand. Clean sand out to plug @ 7520". Lay 30 JTS down. TiH. Tag @ 7955'. Clean out to 8000". Blow hole clean.
3:30__Lay 52 JTS down. Pump bit off. EOT @ 6393'. Blow well
5:30 _Tum well to Flow Watchers.
Pumped 80 BBLS Recavered 200 BBLS 390 BBLS over load.
15’ sand on plug @ 7380"
10" sand on plug @ 7520'
Load 1175 BBLS
Tbg Csg Meter or Prover Flow Swab FL Remarks: % Oil/Cond
Time Choke Press Press Press |Diff  |Orifice Mcfd Tank Gauge |Bbis AM/PM _ |Gravity, Est. Fid, pH, etc.
CODE___ Cost Detail Daily Cumulative Code Caost Detall Daily Cumulative
Location & Roads Casing
Rig $7,300.00 $35,392.00 Tubing
Downhole Equlip $14,000.00 Welthead
Water $11,400.00 $22,400.00 Roustabout $1,000.00
Tanks $750.00 Haot Oil Truck $4,600.00
Supervision $1,000.00 $8,000.00 R it $2,600.00
BOP Rental $350.00 $2,450.00 HES Frac Plugs $8,800.00
W.L. Services $45,958.00 Stinger Wellhead Service $11,993.10
Trucking $29,637.00 $38,722.00 Praxair CO2 Stage 2-5 $158,610.00
Treatment Halliburton Fracing $2563,837.00
Surface Equip Renta $10,000.00 $10,000.00 Flow testers $1,500.00 $7,500.00
Cement DAILY COST $61,187.00
CUM. COMPLETION COST $626,612.10
DRLG/CONST COST $1,246,326.00
TANK BATTERY $140,646.00
TOTAL CUM COST $2,013,584.10
WELL SITE REPRESENTATIVE Date Water on Location Tanks on Location
|Russell Evans §/2/2006 150 BBLS 3-500




RECEIVED

Mooy

5

GAS & MINING

DAILY COMPLETION REPORT ¥
LEASE: WELL NO: [LOCATION: COUNTY: STATE: DW OF
Wildcat 11-1___ |Lizard Creek Vintah Utah -OFOIL,
PBTD: |Form Perfs: Thg: PKR: Csg: Liner: CONTRACTOR:
8030' 6810' 222 JTS 6810' 41/2°M-80 1.6 % 8062 Duco Inc. Rig #3
COMP. DAYS: Today's Operation:
9 Schiumber fog. TOOH W/ TBG. TiH W/ PKR flaw wel,

Yesterdays Operations : Drill Plugs

Hr SITP:

800

Hr. SICP:

FL@:

Dally Lo:

ad Rec Bbls: |Accum Load Rec Bbis:

{Accum Total Load Bbis:

7:00 _Flowing CSG @ 475# on 20/64" choke. Water flowing 20 BBLS per hour. RU Schiumberger. Run production log. RD wireline.

1:00__ Kill well W/ 40 BBLS 2% KCL. TOOH w/TBG. PU 4 1/2" HD PKR. TiH. Kill well W 20 BBLS 2% KCL.
TIH. Kill well W/ 20 BBLS 2% KCL. TIH set PKR @ 6810". 222 JTS. Rig flow line to pit. Fiow well. Rec 225 BBLS.

6:00 Tum well to flow testers. TBG flowing 15 BBLS per hour on 32/64" choke. CSG has strong blow.

Pumped 80 BBLS. Recovered 225 BBLS. 535 BBLS over load.

Load 1175 BBLS

Tbhg Csg Meter or Prover Flow Swab FL Remarks: % Oil/Cond
Time  |Choke [Press Press Press [Diff [Orifice Mefd Tank Gaug Bbis AM/PM__ |Gravity, Est. Fid, pH, etc.
CODE Cost Detall Dally Cumulative Code Cost Detali Daily Cumulative
Location & Roads Casing
Rig $3,067.00 $38,459.00 Tubing
Downhole Equipmer $2,200.00 $16,200.00 Wellhead
Water $22,400.00 Roustabout $1,000.00
Tanks $750.00 Hot Qil Truck $4,600.00
Supervision $1,000.00 $9,000.00 Roustabout $2,600.00
BOP Rental $350.00 $2,800.00 HES Frac Plugs $8,800.00
W.L. Services $17,100.00 $63,058.00 Stinger Wellhead Service $11,993.10
Trucking $38,722.00 Praxair CO2 Stage 25 $158,610.00
Treatment Halliburton Fracing $253,837.00
Surface Equip Renta) $2,000.00 $12,000.00 Flow testers $1,500.00 $9,000.00
Cement DAILY COST $27,217.00
CUM. COMPLETION COST $653.829.10
DRLG/CONST COST $1,246,326.00
TANK BATTERY $140,646.00
TOTAL CUM COST $2,040,801.10
WELL SITE REPRESENTATIVE Date Water on Location Tanks on Location
Russell Evans 5/3/2006 150 BBLS 3-500




DAILY GOMPLETION REPORT

RECEIVED

4 ”~

L. GAS & MINING

[
WELL NO:  [LLOCATION: COUNTY: STATE:
Wildcat 11-1 Lizard Creek Uintah Utah DIV Ok N
PBTD: |Form Perfs: Tbyg: PKR: Ceg: Liner: CONTRAC‘N;QI: Y
8030 60' 23/8 6807 412HD6810'| 41/2" M-80 11.6# 8062 Duco inc. Rig #3
COMP, DAYS: Today's Operation:
10 Flow test stages 1-4 on sales. Flow CSG to pit 8/64" choke 120 PSI.
Yesterdays Operations ; Production log. TIH w/ PKR
Hr SITP: Hr. SICP: F.L @: Daily Load Rec Bbis: |Accum Load Rec Bblis: Accum Total Load Bbls:
| Flowing 240 PSI 36/84" | Flowing 40 PSI 20/64° over load 768 BBLS

7:00 13 hrs Flowing TBG. 240 PSI on 36/64". Recovered 173 BBLS (8 BBLS hr) Flowing CSG 40 PSI on 20/64" choke.

Flowed 60 BBLS (1/2 BBLS hr) Total flowed 13 hrs 233.

7:30Hook TBG up to production unit.

8:30 TBG 1150 PSI

11:25 TBG 1440 PSL. Open well 1o sales.

1:00

TBG on sales 1200 PS| on 10/64" choke 1.2 MCF.

318

THG on sales 750 PSi on 16/64" choke. 1.2 MCF CSG 140 PS! 10/64" choke TBG ifting fluid. CSG flowed 4 BBLS in 8 hrs.

4:.00

5:.00

TBG on sales 600 PS| on 18/64" choke. Selling 1.2 MCF. CSG 100 PSI on 10/64* choke.

TBG on sales 580 PS! on 19/64 choke. Selling 1.0 MCF. CSG 100 PSI on 10/64" choke. 6.65 BBLS in 1 hr off TBG. 1 BBL off CSG

Daily recovery 7.65 BBLS

Total recovery 774.65 BBLS

Load 1175 BBLS
—

Thyg Csg Meter or Prover Flow Swab F.L Remarks: % Ol/Cond
Time Choke  |Press Press Press {Diff | Orifice Mcfd Tank Gauge |Bbls AM/PM__ |Gravity, Est. Fid, pH, etc.
CODE _ Cost Detall Dalty Cumutative Code Cast Detait Oally _ Cumulative
Location & Roads Casing
Rig $4,500.00 $42,959.00 Tubing
Downhols Equ_lm $16,20000] Wallhead
Water $22,400.00 Roustabout $1,000.00
Tanks $750.00 Hot Oll Truck $4,600.00
Supervision $1,000.00 $10,000.00 Roustabout $2,600.00
BOP Rental $350.00 $3,150.00 HES Frac Plugs $8,800.00
W.L. Services $63,058.00 Stinger Wellhead Service $11,993.10
Trucking $38,722.00 Praxair CO2 Stage 2-5 $158 610.00
Treatment Halllburton Fracing $253,837.00
Surface Equip Rent $2,200.00 $14,200.00 Flow testers $1,500.00 $10,500.00
Cement DAILY COST $9,550.00
CUM. COMPLETION COST $663,379.10
DRLG/CONST COST $1,246,326.00
TANK BATTERY $140,646.00
TOTAL CUM COST $2,050,351.10
WELL SITE REPRESENTATIVE Date Water on Location Tanks on Location
Russeli Evans 5/4/2006 100 BBLS rig tank. -




FORM 3i60-4 SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE* FORM APPROVED
(Tuly 1992) (See otherin- JOMB NO. 1004-0137
UNITED STATES structions on | Expires: February 28, 1995
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR reverse side) |5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-73904
T TV, AL UTTE UK TRIDE VAN
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG* NA
a A 7 ONIT AGREEMENT NAME
WEL weLy X DRY Oth N/A
1b. TYPE OF WELL ‘q] D o
| 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME, WELL NO.
wy:ua OV;E ED BACE RESV'RD Other Lizard Creck #11-1
- [s) S APIWELLNO.
ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-36316
3 ADDRYESS AND TELEPHONE NO. T0. TLOCAT
P.O. BOX 1668, VERNAL, UT 84078 435-789-0414 Wildcat
2. LOCATION OF WELL (Report locations clearly and in accordance with any State requirements. *) 11.SEC,, T., R,, M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY
At Surface 1 OR AREA
NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E  870' FNL 1293' FWL ; SEC 11 T11S R22E
At top prod. Interval reported below -
Block & Survey: S.LB. & M
At total depth 14. PERMIT NO. DATE ISSUED 12. COUNTY OR PARISH 13. STATE
43-047-36316 7/19/05 UINTAH UTAH
15. DATE SPUDDED 16. DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (Reedy to prod.) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, KT, GR, ETC,)* 15. ELEV. CASINGHEAD
10/14/08 3/4/2006 05/04/06 5131' GR 5131'
20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 71. PLUG, BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLE COMPL., 23, INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS
HOW MANY* DRILLED BY
8080' mp | 8030 —— | 0-8080
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION--TOP, BOTTOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL
SURVEY MADE
6470-7704' MESA VERDE
1.8 degree
26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED
HRI,SDL/DSN,ML,MICRO NO
23. CASING RECORD (Report all strings set in well)
CASING SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE TOP OF CEMENT, CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED
9 5/8" H-40 32.3# 996.4' KB 12 1/4" TO SURF W/ 425 SX "G" +2% NONE
CACL + 1/4 SX FLOCELE + 2% GEL
41/2" M-80 11.6# 8062’ 77/8" LEAD -215 SX HIFILL V TOC 200’
TAIL - 1025 SX 50/50 POZ "G"
29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBING RECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)
2 3/8" J-55 7778 None
31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and number) 32. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.
INTERVAL SIZE NUMBER DEPTH INTERVAL (MD)

see attached page

PRODUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing, gas lift, pumping--size and type of pump) 'WELL STATUS (Producing or shut-in)
5/4/06 FLOWING PRODUCING
DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N. FOR OIL--BBLS. GAS--MCF. ‘WATER--BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD
05/13/06 24 64/64 — | 3 354 77
FLOW. TUBING PRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL-BBL. GAS-—-MCF. ‘WATER~-BBL. OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR.)
24-HOUR RATE
0 140# — | 3 | 354 | 77

34. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, used for fuel, vented, etc.) TEST WITNESSED BY

SOLD Leland Evans

35. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS
L

an

—~
36. I hereby cemfyﬂt:hj‘f iy
] i
SIGNED )\ !

ed ihformation 15 compiete end correct as determined from all available records

(AAAAL mme___ ADMINISTRATIVE ASSISTANT paTE___5/19/2006
‘ Oj *(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on Reverse Side) RECEIVED
Title 18 U.S.C. Sec\i 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States

any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any mater within its jurisdiction.

MAY 2 2 2006
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interval, size and number)

INTERVAL
T700'-7704"
7650" -7562'

7474'-7476
7489'-7491

7544'-7550"
7552'-7557

7309'-7311
7288'-7292
7247-7249'
7206-7208

7019'-7021
7008'-7010'
6914'-6916
6870'-6876

6744-6745
6690-6692
6470-6472

3 SP¥
3 SPF¥

3 SPF
3 SPF

3 SPF
3 SPF

3 SPF
3 SPF
3 SPF
3 SPF

3 SPF
3 SPF
3 SPF
3 SPF

3 SPF
3 SPF
3 SPF

STAGE 1
STAGE 1

STAGE 2
STAGE 2

STAGE 2
STAGE 2

STAGE 3
STAGE 3
STAGE 3
STAGE 3

STAGE 4
STAGE 4
STAGE 4
STAGE 4

STAGE 5
STAGE 5
STAGE 5

SIZE
0.42
0.42

0.42
0.42

0.42
0.42

0.42
0.42
0.42
0.42

0.42
0.42
0.42
0.42

0.42
0.42
0.42

i8
15

AN

Ll
= - -

AW

32.

ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL (MD)

77007703 PERF ONLY...INTERVAL NOT FRACED
7650 -7562" PERF ONLY..INT ERVAL NOT FRACED
7374-7876 TRAC 35,110% 20/40 OTTAWA SAND
7489-7491 FRAC 35,110# 20/40 OTTAWA SAND
7544'-7550" PERF ONLY..INTERVAL NOT FRACED
7552'-7557 PERF ONLY...INTERVAL NOT FRACED
7309'-7311 FRAC 88,307# 20/40 OTTAWA SAND
7288'-7292 FRAC 88,307# 20/40 OTTAWA SAND
7247-7249" FRAC 88,307# 20/40 OTTAWA SAND
7206-7208 FRAC 88,3074 20/40 OTTAWA SAND
7019°'-7021' FRAC 100,895#4 20/40 OTTAWA SAND
7008'-7010° FRAC 100,895# 20/40 OTTAWA SAND
6914'-6916’ FRAC 100,895# 20/40 OTTAWA SAND
6870'-6876 FRAC 100,895# 20/40 OTTAWA SAND
6470-6745 FRAC 93,622 # 20/40 OTTAWA SAND




37. SUMMARY OF POROUS ZONES: (Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof, cored intervals, and all

drill-stem, tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures, and 38. GEOLOGIC MARKERS
recoveries);
FORMATION TOP BOTTOM DESCRIPTION, CONTENTS, ETC. TOP
NAME TRUE
. MEAS. DEPTH VERT. DEPTH
MESA VERDE 5460'

COPIES: BLM - VERNAL/ORIG. & 2 COPIES; DIV. OG&M - DALLAS 1 COPY;




FORM 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993
S. Lease Designation and Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-73904
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reenter a different reservoir. 6. if Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT - for such proposals N/A

7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/A

1. Type of Well

8. Well Name and No.

e [ e [ omer CO\’HDENHAL Lizard Creek 11-1

9. API Well No.
2. Name of Operator 43-047-36316
ROSEWOOD RESOURCES, INC. 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
3. Address and Telephone No. Wildcat
P.O. Box 1668, Vernal, UT 435-789-0414 11. County or Parish, State

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)
UINTAH CO., UTAH

NWNW SEC 11 T11S R22E  870' FNL 1293' FWL  SLB&M

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(es) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of intent ] Abandonment | Change of Plans
Recompletion | New Construction
D Subsequent Report Plugging Back | Non-Routine Fracturing
| Casing Repair | Water Shut-Off
D Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing | Conversion to Injection
Other commingling : Dispose Water
(Note: Report results of muttiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, including estimated date of starting any proposed
work. If well is directionally drilled, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)*

Rosewood Resources, Inc. respectfully requests permission to perforate zones in the Wasatch formation on
the above mentioned well. We also request to commingle production in the Wasatch and Mesa Verde
formations. The Wasatch and Mesa Verde are both participating areas and this well is on a lease only basis,
it is not within a unit. All interest owners are the same for both formations.

Thank you and please call with any questions or concerns.
Jill Henrie o RECEIVED
Rosewood Resources, Inc. : SEP 1 8 2006
435-789-0414 X10 : i
€ haal _ , *  DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING
COPIES: ORIG. & 2-BLM; DIV. OG&M; DALLAS OFFICE i
14. | hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Signed @SQCM WAL Title Administrative Assistant Date 09/12/06
! 1 A
(This space for Fﬁi?}al or State office use)
Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any:
e s e DB LD BRI SECIENT DATA WAS SUBM D A ON (see RG49-3-
Title T8 .l X ectlon 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowmgly and willfully to make to a ltm tr agepty of the ¥ ; ited States andy falss, fictitious or fraudulem
A 4‘ \Y ‘~ " December 1, 2006

Utah Divisioh of Oil. Gas arld Mining



Sundry Nunber: 68860 API Well Nunber: 43047363160000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UT0-73904 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below

current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION | 7-UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well LIZZARD CREEK 11-1
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
ROSEWOOD RESOURCES INC 43047363160000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
PO Box 1668, Vernal , UT, 84078 435 789-0414 Ext BITTER CREEK
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
0870 FNL 1293 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: NWNW Section: 11 Township: 11.0S Range: 22.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
J NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
J CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
D SUBSEQUENT REPORT D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT |:| NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D WATER SHUTOFF D SI TA STATUS EXTENSION |:| APD EXTENSION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Please change this well to shut in status. It was shut in on 11/21/2015 Accepted by the

due to economic instability. Thank you Jill Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
January 06, 2016

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Jill Henrie 435 789-0414 Administravtive Assistant
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 1/5/2016

RECEI VED: Jan. 05, 2016
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