
STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING AMENDED REPORT O
00 1 (highlight changes)

5. MINERALLEASE NO 6. SURFACE:

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL ML-22347-A State

1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILL REENTER DEEPEN Ü 7. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS OTHER SINGLE ZONE MULTIPLEZONE
8. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

WESTPORT OIL &GAS COMPANY L.P. LOVE1121-16B
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 S. 1200 E. VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:

ATSURFACE: 648'FNL & 1630'FEL NWNE 16 11S 21E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCINGZONE:

14. DISTANCEIN MILESAND DIRECTIONFROM NEAREST TOWN OR R)ST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

25.6 MILESSOUTHEAST OF OURAY, UTAH UINTAH
UTAH

15. DISTANCETO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRESIN LEASE: 17. NJMBER OF ACRESASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:

648' 1275.39 40.00

18. DISTANCETO NEAREST WELL(DRILLING,COMFLETED,OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPflON:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)

REFER TO TOPO C 8,800 RLBOOO5238
21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATEDATEWORK WILLSTART: 23. ESTIMATEDDURATION:

5544'GL

24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTINGPROGRAM

SiZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY,YlELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT

12 1/4 9 5/8 H-40 32.3# 1,900 265 SX

7 7/8 4 1/2 I-80 11.6# 8,800 1880 SX

25 ATTACHMENTS

VERIFYTHE FOLLOWINGAREATTACHED INACCORDANCEWITH THE UTAHOILAND GAS CONSERVATIONGENERAL RULES:

WELL PLATOR MAP PREPARED BYLICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGilfER COMPLETE DRILLINGPLAN

EVIDENCEOF DIVISIONOF WATER RIGHTS APPROVALFOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHERTHAN THE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) HEILA UPCgGO TITLE REGULATORY ANALYST

SIGNATURE DATE 1/19/2004

(This space for State use only)

Utah Division of
API NUMBERASSIGNED:

gi,gasand in AN 2 4 M

(11/2001) (See
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WESTPORT OIL AND GAS COMPANY, LP.
TiiS, R21E, S. L. B. &M' Well location, LOVE#1121--16B, located1923 Brass Cap,is2; aros, cap ,,,,.igh, Pile OS shown in the NW 1/4 NE 1/4 ofr's 's SO9'50'08"W - 2643.11' (Meas.) SB9°48'55"W

- 2641.90' (Meas.) or st2nes Section 16, T11S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. UintahA L
1923 Bross cop ÛOUnty, Utah.
,

,gh, Mound
BASIS OF ELEVATION

1630. SPOT ELEVATIONAT THE SOUTHEAST CORNER OFLOVE /1121--168 SECTION 2, T11S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE
s BIG PACK MTN NE, QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAHElev. Ungraded Ground = 5544

COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTEQUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP)
PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF
THE INTERIOR,GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID ELEVATION
IS MARKEDAS BEING 5584 FEET.

N
192J Brass Cap,
1.5' High, Pile

a of Stones1923 Brass Cap
1.0' High, Mound
of Stones

--Il ill-
- i-i- III-i-Illli--Illii-Mi

SCALE

----- CERTIFICATE ggy
THIS IS TO CERT1FYTHAT THEABOVE i ROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS

,

ME•0R°WN
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME DE AND COR 70 THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEANDBE

,

1923 Brass Cap, 1923 Brass Cap, 1923 Brass Cap, REGSTER LAN VEYQR
1.0' High, Pile 1.5' H/ph, P//e 1.0' H/gh, Pile REGl N.NO. 161319
of Stones of Stones of Stones STANB9°5J'0]T

- 2641.62' (Meas.) N89°54'18T
- 2642.57' (Meas.)

BASIS OF BEARINGS UINTAH SGINEERING & I AND VEYING
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. 85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

(435) 789-1017
LEGEND: (AUTONOMOUSNAD83)

SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:LATITUDE= 39°51'57.76" (39.866044) 1" =
1000° 11-26-04 12-1-04=

90° SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 109°34'07.73" (109.568814) PARTY REFERENCES
= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. (AUTONOMOUSNAD 27) K.K. F.I. C.G. G.L.O. PLATLATITUDE=

39°51°57.88" (39.866078)A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED- LONGITUDE= 109°34'05.26" (109.568128)
WEATHER FILE

COOL WESTPORT OIL AND GAS COMPANY,
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LOVE #1121-16B
NWINE Sec. 16,T11S,R21E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

ML-22347-A

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

DRILLING PROGRAM

1. Estimated Tops of Important Geologic Markers:

Formation Depth

Uinta Surface
Green River 1000'
Wasatch 3950'
Mesaverde 6700'
TD 8800'

2. Estimated Depths of Anticipated Water, Oil, Gas, or Mineral Formations:

Substance Formation Depth

Green River 1000'
Gas Wasatch 3950'
Gas Mesaverde 6700'

Water N/A
Other Minerals N/A

3. Pressure Control Equipment (Schematic Attached)

Please see the attached Drilling Program.

4. Proposed Casing & Cementing Program:

Please see the attached Drilling Program

5. Drilling Fluids Program:

Please see the attached Drilling Program.

6. Evaluation Program:

Please see the attached Drilling
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7. Abnormal Conditions:

Maximum anticipated bottomhole pressure calculated at 8800' TD, approximately equals 3520 psi
(calculated at 0.4 psi/foot).

Maximum anticipated surface pressure equals approximately 1584 psi (bottomholepressure minus the
pressure of a partially evacuated hole calculated at 0.22 psi/foot).

8. Anticipated Starting Dates:

Drilling isplanned to commence immediately upon approval of this application.

9. Variances:

Please see the attached Drilling Program.

10. Other Information:

Please see the attached Drilling
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Westport Oil and Gas Company, L.P.
DRILLINGPROGRAM

COMPANYNAME Westport Oiland Gas Co., L.P. DATE January 7, 2005

WELLNAME LOVE 1121-16B TD 8,800• MorTvo
FIELD LOVE COUNTY Uintah STATE Utah ELEVATION 5,540' GL KB 5,555'

SURFACE LOCATION 648' FNL& 1630' FEL, NWNESEC. 16, T11S, R21E BHL Straight Hole

Latitude: 39.866044 Longitude: 109.568814

OBJECTIVEZONE(S) Wasatch/Mesaverde

ADDITIONAL INFO Regulatory Agencies: BLM,UDOGM(SURF & MINERALS),Tri-County Health Dept.

e - • • • s

e e • a •

40' 14"

12-1/4" 9-5/8", 32.3#, H-40, STC Air mist

Catch water sample, if possible,
from 0 to 3,950'

Green River @ 1,050
Preset fl GL @

1900 MD

Air Mist,Polymer

Mud logging program TBD Aerated Water/Brine

Ope i hole logging program f/ TD - surf csg 7-//8" 4-1/2",11.6#, I-80 or 8.3-10.0 ppg
equivalenti TC casing

Wasatch @ 3,950'

Mverde @ 6,700'

Max anticipated
Mud required

TD @ 8,800' 10.0 ppg

DHD LOVE1121-16B
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Westport Oil and Gas Company, L.P.
DRILLING PROGRAM

CASING PROGRAM
e ae•

CONDUCTOR 14" 0-40'

2270 1370 254000
SURFACE 9-5/8" O to 1900 32.30 H-40 STC À.86 1.54 4.73

7780 6350 201000

PRODUCTION 4-1/2" O to 8800 11.60 I-80 LTC 2.95 1.39 2.26

1) Max Anticipated Surf. Press.(MASP) (Surface Casing) = (Pore Pressure at next csg point-(0.22 psilft-partial evac gradient x TVD ofnext csg point)

2) MASP (Prod Casing) = Pore Pressure at TD - (.22psilft-partial evac gradient x TD)

(Burst Assumptions: TD = 10.0 ppg) .22 psilft = gradient for partially evac wellbore

(Collapse Assumption: Fully Evacuated Casing, Max MW) (Tension Assumptions: Air Weight of Casing*Buoy.Fact. of water)

MASP 2640 psi
******* * Burst SF is low but cag is much stronger than formation at 2000'. EMW @ 2000' for 2270# is 21.6 ppg or 1.13 pallft

CEMENT PROGRAM

SURFACE LEAD 500 | Premium cmt + 2% CaCI 215 60% 15.60 1.18

Option 1 + .25 pps flocele
TOP OUT CMT (1) 200 20 gals sodium silicate + Premium cmt 50 15.60 1.18

+ 2% CaCI + .25 pps flocele
TOP OUT CMT (2) as required Premium cmt + 2% CaCI as req. 15.60 1.18

SURFACE NOTE: Ifwell will ¢Irculate water to surface option 2 will be utilized

Option 2 LEAD 1500 Prem cmt + 16% Gel + 10 pps gilsonite 170 35% 11.00 3.82

+.25 pps Flocele + 3% salt BWOC
TAIL 500 Premium cmt + 2% CaCI 180 35% 15.60 1.18

+ .25 pps flocele
TOP OUT CMT as required Premium cmt + 2% CaCI as reg. 15.60 1.18

PRODUCTION LEAD 3,450' Premium Lite II+ 3% KCI + 0.25 pps 380 60% 11.00 3.38
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FLOAT EQUIPMENT & CENTRALIZERS
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tour sheet. Function test rams on each trip. Maintain safetyvalve & inside BOP on rig floor at all times. Kelly to be equippedwith upper

& lower kelly valves.

Drop Totco surveysevery2000'. Maximum allowablehole angle is 5 degrees.
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LOVE 1121-16B
NW/NE Sec. 16, T11S-R21E

Uintah County, UT
ML-22347-A

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI-POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

1. Existing Roads:

Refer to Topo Map A for directions to the location.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2-mile radius.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 mile radius.

Improvements to existing access roads shall be determined at the on-site inspection.

All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all drilling and completion
operations associated with this well.

2. Planned Access Roads:

Approximately 0.1 Miles of access road is proposed. Refer to Topo Map B.

The upgraded and new portions of the access road will be crowned and ditched with a running
surface of 18 feet and a maximum disturbed width of 30 feet, unless modryied at the on-site

inspection. Appropriate water control will be installed to control erosion.

Existence of pipelines; maximum grade; turnouts; major cut and fills,culverts, or bridges;
gates, cattle guards, fencecuts, or modlyications to existing facilitiesshall be determined
at the on-site.

The access road was centerline flagged during timeof staking.

Surfacing material may be necessary, depending upon weather conditions.

Surface disturbance and vehicular traffic will be limited to the approved location and approved
access route. Any additional area needed will be approved in advance.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1-Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.

4. Location of Existing & Proposed Facilities:

Thefollowingguidelines will apply if the well isproductive.

All production facilities will be located on the disturbed portion of the well pad and at a
minimum of 25 feet from the toe of the back slope or the top of the fill
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LOVE 1121-16B Surface Use & Operations Plan Page 2

A dike will be constructed completely around those production facilities which contain
fluids (i.e., production tanks, produced water tanks, and/or heater/treater). These dikes
will be constructed of compacted subsoil, be impervious, hold 100% of the capacity of
the largest tank, and be independent of the back cut.

All permanent (on-site six months or longer) above the ground structures constructed or
installed, including pumping units, will be painted a flat, non-reflective, earthtone color
to match one of the standard environmental colors, as determined by the five state Rocky
Mountain Inter-Agency Committee.

All facilities will be painted within six months of installation. Facilities required to comply
with the Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will be excluded. The required color
is Carlsbad Canyon, standard color number 2.5Y 6/2.

Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to protect livestock and prevent wildlife entry.

Approximately 85' of pipeline is proposed. Refer to Topo D.

5. Location and Type of Water Supply:

Water for drilling purposes will be obtained from Dalbo Inc.'s underground well located in Ouray,
Utah, Sec. 32, T4S, R3E, Water User Claim #43-8496, Application #53617.

Water will be hauled to location over the roads marked on Maps A and B.

No water well is to be drilled on this lease.

6. Source of Construction Materials:

Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.

Any gravel will be obtained from a commercial source.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Drill cuttings will be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

Drilling fluids, including salts and chemicals, will be contained in the reserve pit. Upon
termination of drilling and completion operations, the liquid contents of the reserve pit
will be removed and disposed of at an approved waste disposal facility within 120 days
after drilling is terminated.

The reserve pit will be constructed on the location and will not be located within natural
drainage, where a flood hazard exists or surface runoff will destroy or damage the pit
walls. The reserve pit will be constructed so that it will not leak, break, or allow discharge
of liquids. The need for a reserve pit liner will be determined at the on-site inspection.

If a plastic reinforced liner is used, it will be a minimum of 12 mil thick, with sufficient
bedding used to cover any rocks. The liner will overlap the pit walls and be covered with
dirt and/or rocks to hold it in place. No trash or scrap that could puncture the liner will
be disposed of in the
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Any spills of oil, gas, salt water, or other noxious fluids will be immediately cleaned up and
removed to an approved disposal site.

A chemical porta-toilet will be furnished with the drilling rig.

Garbage, trash, and other waste materials will be collected in a portable, self-contained, fully
enclosed trash cage during operations. No trash will be burned on location.

All debris and other waste material not contained in the trash cage will be cleaned up and
removed from the location immediately after removal of the drilling rig.

Any open pits will be fenced during the operations. The fencing will be maintained until
such time as the pits are backfilled.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title III (hazardous materials) in an amount
greater than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported,or disposed of
annually in association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous
substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, produced,
stored, transported, or disposed of in association with thedrilling of this well.

Any produced water from the proposed well will be contained in a water tank and will then be hauled
By truck to one of the pre-approved disposal sites: RNI, Sec. 5, T9S, R22E, NBU #159, Sec. 35,
T9S, R21E, Ace Oilfield, Sec. 2, T6S, R20E, MC&MC, Sec. 12, T6S, Rl9E.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

None are anticipated.

9. Well Site Lavout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills, and locations
of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailer parking, spoil dirt stockpile(s), and surface
material stockpile(s). This section is subject to modification as a result of the on-site

inspection.

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads.

If it is determined that a pit liner will be used at theon-site inspection, the reserve pit will be lined, and
when the reserve pit is closed, the pit liner will be buried below plow depth.

All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

39 inch net wire will be used with at least one strand of barbed wire on top of the net wire.
Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of reinforcement rod is attached to the
top of the entire fence.

The net wire shall be no more than two inches above the ground. The barbed wire shall be
three inches over the net wire. Total height of the fence shall be at least 42
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Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner to keep the fence tight at all times.

Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces. Maximum distance
between any 2 fence posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

All wire shall be stretched, by using a stretching device, before it is attached to corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations, and on the fourth
side when the rig moves off location. Pits will be fenced and maintained until cleanup.

Location size may change prior to the drilling of the well due to current rig availability. If the
proposed location is not large enough to accommodate the drilling rig the location will be re-surveyed
and a Form 9 shall be submitted.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Producing Location:

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of all
unused tubing, materials, trash, and debris not required for production.

Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons in the pit shall be removed in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

If a plastic, nylon reinforced liner is used, it shall be torn and perforated before backfilling of
the reserve pit.

Before any dirt work associated with location restoration takesplace, the reserve pit shall
be as dry as possible. All debris in it will be removed. Other waste and spoil materials
will be disposed of immediately upon completion of operations.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production facilities/operations
will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours. The reserve pit will be reclaimed
within 90 days from the date of well completion, weather permitting.

To prevent surface water (s) from standing (ponding) on the reclaimed reserve pit area, final
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All disturbed surfaces will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours, with reclamation
of the well pad and access road to be performed as soon as practical after final abandonment.
Reseeding operations will be performed after completion of other reclamation operations.

11. Surface Ownership:

SITLA
675 East 500 South, Suite 500
Salt Lake City, UT 84102

12. Other Information:

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with all applicable laws, regulations, the approved Plan of Operations, and any
applicable Notice of Lessees. The Operator is fully responsible for the actions of his
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished to the field representative
to ensure compliance.

The Operator will control noxious weeds along Rights-Of-Way for roads, pipelines, well
sites, or other applicable facilities.

A Class III archaeological survey has been completed and a copy of this report will be submitted when
it becomes available.

13. Lessee's or Operators's Representative & Certification:

Sheila Upchego Randy Bayne
Regulatory Analyst Drilling Manager
Westport O&G Co. L.P. Westport O&G Co. L.P.
P.O. Box l148 P.O. Box 1148
Vernal, UT 84078 Vernal, UT 84078
(435) 781-7024 (435) 781-7018

Certification: All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that fullcompliance
is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approved Plan of
Operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

The Operator will be fully responsible for the actions of its subcontractors. A complete copy of the
approved "Application for Permit to Drill" will be furnished to the field representative(s) to ensure
compliance and shall be on location during all construction and drilling operations.

Westport O& GCo. L.P. is considered to be the operator of the subject well. Westport O& G Co. L.P
agrees to be responsible under terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon
leased lands.

Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for lease activities is being provided by Westport O&G Co.
L.P. State Surety Bond:
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I hereby certify that I, or persons under my supervision, have inspected the proposed drill site and
access route, that I am familiar with the conditions that currently exist; that the statementsmade in this
plan are, to the best of my knowledge, trueand correct; and the work associated with the operations
proposed herein will be performed by the Operator, its contractors, and subcontractors in conformity
with this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved.
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WESTPORT OIL AND GAS COMPANY, L.P.
LOVE #1121-16B

SECTION 16, T11S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL, UTAH ALONG U.S.
HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 14.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATE
HIGHWAY 88; EXIT LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 17.0 MILES TO OURAY, UTAH; PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY,
THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 11.2 MILESON THE SEEP
RIDGE ROAD TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO
THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY, THEN
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 6.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION
OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND
PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 3.6 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTINGROAD TO THE WEST; TURN RIGHT
AND PROCEED IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.5 MILES TO
THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN
LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.4 MILES
TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
NORTHWEST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHWEST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHWESTERLY, THEN NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3
MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
WEST; PROCEED IN A WESTERLY, THENNORTHWESTERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY,
THEN NORTHERLY, THEN SOUTHERLY, THEN WESTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 1.5 MILES TO THE BEGINNING OF THE PROPOSED ACCESS TO
THE SOUTHWEST; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN A SOUTHWESTERLY, THEN
NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.1 MILES TO THE PROPOSED
LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL LOCATION
IS APPROXIMATELY 56.6
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WESTPORT OIL AND GAS COMPANY, L.P.
LOVE #1121-16B

LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
SECTION 16, T11S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.

N E

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHWESTERLY

I . I I

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHWESTERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATIONPHOTOs 1 1 30 04 ruoro
85 South 200 East Vemal, Utah 84078 10MW DAY YEAR

435-789-1017 uelstä)uelsine.com TAKENBY:K.K. DRAWNBY:LK. £VISED:
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WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 01/24/2005 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-36254

WELL NAME: LOVE 1121-16B

OPERATOR: WESTPORT OIL & GAS CO ( N2115 )
CONTACT: SHEILA UPCHEGO PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-7024

PROPOSED LOCATION:

MWNE 16 110S 210E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SURFACE: 0648 FNL 1630 FEL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 0648 FNL 1630 FEL

Engineering /
LOVE ( 622 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 3 - State Surface
LEASE NUMBER: ML-22347-A

SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State
LATITUDE: 39.86604

PROPOSED FORMATION: MVRD

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.5682

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

V Plat R649-2-3.

Bond: Fed[] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit

Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

\ Water Permit \/ R649-3-3. Exception
(No. 43-8496 )

Drilling Unit
¿\ RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No:(Date: )
Eff Date:

A Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: eÑ§

STIPULATIONS: pg
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T11S R21E

LOVE UNIT WVEU
1121-10G
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WOLF14
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|

OPERATOR: WESTPORT OdcG CO (N2115)

SEC. 16 T.11S R.21E

FIEU: LOVE (2)

COUNTY:UINTAH

SPACING: R669-3-3 / EXCEFFION LOCATION . • •Utah OilGas and Mming
delle Units.shP Fields.shp

GAS INJECTION EXPLORATORY ABANDONED
GAS STORAGE GAS STORAGE ACIIVE

× T.OCATION ABANDONED
NEW LOCATION NF PP OIL COMBINED

+ FLUG GED & ABANDONED NF 5ECONDARY INACTIVE
o PRODUCING GAS PENDENG FROFOSED
$ FRODUCIN G OIL Pi OIL STORAGE
C SHUT·lN GAS PP GAS TERMINATED

SHUT-IN OIL
× TEMP. ABANDONED PF GEOTHERML S

TEST WELL PP OIL

^ WATER INJECTION SECONDARY

* WATER SUPPLY TERMINATED PREFARED BY:DIANA WHITNEY
a WATER DISFOSAL DATE:
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Diana Whitney - Well Clearance Page 1

From: Ed Bonner
To: Whitney, Diana
Date: 2/8/2005 9:37:16 AM
Subject: Well Clearance

The following wells have been given cultural resource clearance by the Trust Lands Cultural Resources
Group:

Westport Oil& Gas Company
Love 1121-16L
Love 1121-16P
Love 1121-16N
Love 1121-16H
Love 1121-16J
Love 1121-16F
Love 1121-16B

Ifyou have any questions regarding this matter please give me a call.

CC: Garrison, LaVonne; Hill,Brad; Hunt,
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ON- SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: WESPORT OIL AND GAS COMPANY, L.P.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: LOVE 1121-16B

API NUMBER:43-047-36254

LEASE: ML-22347-A FIELD/UNIT: LOVE
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NW/NE Sec: 16 TWP: 11S RNG: 21E 1630' FEL 648' FNL
LEGAL WELL SITING: 460 F SEC. LINE; 460 F 1/4,1/4 LINE; 920 F ANOTHER WELL.

GPS COORD (FER):4413664N 0622471E SURFACE OWNER: STATE OF UTAE

PARTICIPANTS

DAVID W. HACKFORD (DOGM), FLOYD BARTLETT (DWR), CARROLL ESTES, CLAY
EINERSON, DEBRA DOMENICI (WESTPORT). DAVID KAY (UELS).

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY

SITE IS IN AN AREA OF LOW ROLLING HILLS AND SHALLOW DRAWS DRAINING TO
THE EAST FOR 800' TO COTTONWOOD WASH, THEN NORTH TOWARD THE WHITE RIVER
12 MILES AWAY. OURAY, UTAH IS 25.6 MILES TO THE NORTHWEST. COTTONWOOD
WASH IS A DRY WATERCOURSE FOR MOST OF THE YEAR, WITH WATER PRESENT ONLY
DURING SNOW MELT OR AFTER RAINFALL.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE:WILDLIFE AND LIVESTOCK GRAZING, HUNTING.

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: LOCATION WILL BE 350' BY 273'. ACCESS ROAD
WILL BE 0.1 MILES.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: SEE ATTACHED MAP FROM
GIS DATABASE.

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: ALL PRODUCTION
FACILITIES WILL BE ON LOCATION AND ADDED AFTER DRILLING WELL. PIPELINE
WILL FOLLOW ACCESS ROAD.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: ALL CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL WILL BE
BORROWED FROM SITE DURING CONSTRUCTION OF LOCATION.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: NONE WILL BE REQUIRED.

WILL DRILLING AT THIS LOCATION GENERATE PUBLIC INTEREST OR CONCERNS?
(EXPLAIN): UNLIKELY.

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

DRILLED CUTTINGS WILL BE SETTLED INTO RESERVE PIT. LIQUIDS FROM PIT WILL
BE ALLOWED TO EVAPORATE. FORMATION WATER WILL BE CONFINED TO STORAGE
TANKS. SEWAGE FACILITIES, STORAGE AND DISPOSAL WILL BE HANDLED BY
COMMERCIAL CONTRACTOR. TRASH WILL BE CONTAINED IN TRASH BASKETS AND
RAULED TO AN APPROVED LAND
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EINERSON, DEBRA DOMENICI (WESTPORT). DAVID KAY (UELS).

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY

SITE IS IN AN AREA OF LOW ROLLING HILLS AND SHALLOW DRAWS DRAINING TO
THE EAST FOR 800' TO COTTONWOOD WASH, THEN NORTH TOWARD THE WHITE RIVER
12 MILES AWAY. OURAY, UTAH IS 25.6 MILES TO THE NORTHWEST. COTTONWOOD
WASH IS A DRY WATERCOURSE FOR MOST OF THE YEAR, WITH WATER PRESENT ONLY
DURING SNOW MELT OR AFTER RAINFALL.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE:WILDLIFE AND LIVESTOCK GRAZING, HUNTING.

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: LOCATION WILL BE 350' BY 273'. ACCESS ROAD
WILL BE 0.1 MILES.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: SEE ATTACHED MAP FROM
GIS DATABASE.

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: ALL PRODUCTION
FACILITIES WILL BE ON LOCATION AND ADDED AFTER DRILLING WELL. PIPELINE
WILL FOLLOW ACCESS ROAD.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: ALL CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL WILL BE
BORROWED FROM SITE DURING CONSTRUCTION OF LOCATION.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: NONE WILL BE REQUIRED.

WILL DRILLING AT THIS LOCATION GENERATE PUBLIC INTEREST OR CONCERNS?
(EXPLAIN): UNLIKELY.

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

DRILLED CUTTINGS WILL BE SETTLED INTO RESERVE PIT. LIQUIDS FROM PIT WILL
BE ALLOWED TO EVAPORATE. FORMATION WATER WILL BE CONFINED TO STORAGE
TANKS. SEWAGE FACILITIES, STORAGE AND DISPOSAL WILL BE HANDLED BY
COMMERCIAL CONTRACTOR. TRASH WILL BE CONTAINED IN TRASH BASKETS AND
RAULED TO AN APPROVED LAND

ON- SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: WESPORT OIL AND GAS COMPANY, L.P.
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LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: ALL PRODUCTION
FACILITIES WILL BE ON LOCATION AND ADDED AFTER DRILLING WELL. PIPELINE
WILL FOLLOW ACCESS ROAD.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: ALL CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL WILL BE
BORROWED FROM SITE DURING CONSTRUCTION OF LOCATION.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: NONE WILL BE REQUIRED.

WILL DRILLING AT THIS LOCATION GENERATE PUBLIC INTEREST OR CONCERNS?
(EXPLAIN): UNLIKELY.

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

DRILLED CUTTINGS WILL BE SETTLED INTO RESERVE PIT. LIQUIDS FROM PIT WILL
BE ALLOWED TO EVAPORATE. FORMATION WATER WILL BE CONFINED TO STORAGE
TANKS. SEWAGE FACILITIES, STORAGE AND DISPOSAL WILL BE HANDLED BY
COMMERCIAL CONTRACTOR. TRASH WILL BE CONTAINED IN TRASH BASKETS AND
RAULED TO AN APPROVED LAND



ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETERS

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: NONE

FLORA/FAUNA: SAGEBRUSH, SHADSCALE, PRICKLEY PEAR, CHEAT GRASS, HORSE
BRUSH: PRONGHORN, COYOTES, SONGBIRDS, RAPTORS, RODENTS, RABBITS.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: LIGHT BROWN SANDY CLAY.

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: VERY LITTLE NATURAL EROSION.
SEDIMENTATION AND STABILITY ARE NOT A PROBLEM AND LOCATION CONSTRUCTION
SHOULDN'T CAUSE AN INCREASE IN STABILITY OR EROSION PROBLEMS.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: NONE OBSERVED

RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: 100' BY 150' AND 10' DEEP.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): A PLASTIC LINER WILL

NOT BE REQUIRED FOR RESERVE PIT.

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN

AS PER SITLA.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: AS PER SITLA.

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: SITE HAS BEEN INSPECTED BY MONTGOMERY
ARCHEOLOGICAL CONSULTANTS. A REPORT OF THIS INVESTIGATION WILL BE PLACED ON
FILE.

OTHER OBSERVATIONS/COMMENTS

THIS PREDRILL INVESTIGATION WAS CONDUCTED ON A COLD, WINDY DAY WITH
PARTIAL SNOW COVER.

ATTACHMENTS

PHOTOS OF THIS SITE WERE TAKEN AND PLACED ON FILE.

DAVID W. HACKFORD 2/15/05, 10:15 AM
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE

ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETERS

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: NONE

FLORA/FAUNA: SAGEBRUSH, SHADSCALE, PRICKLEY PEAR, CHEAT GRASS, HORSE

BRUSH: PRONGHORN, COYOTES, SONGBIRDS, RAPTORS, RODENTS, RABBITS.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: LIGHT BROWN SANDY CLAY.

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: VERY LITTLE NATURAL EROSION.
SEDIMENTATION AND STABILITY ARE NOT A PROBLEM AND LOCATION CONSTRUCTION
SHOULDN'T CAUSE AN INCREASE IN STABILITY OR EROSION PROBLEMS.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: NONE OBSERVED

RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: 100' BY 150' AND 10' DEEP.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): A PLASTIC LINER WILL

NOT BE REQUIRED FOR RESERVE PIT.

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN

AS PER SITLA.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: AS PER SITLA.

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: SITE HAS BEEN INSPECTED BY MONTGOMERY

ARCHEOLOGICAL CONSULTANTS. A REPORT OF THIS INVESTIGATION WILL BE PLACED ON

FILE.

OTHER OBSERVATIONS/COMMENTS

THIS PREDRILL INVESTIGATION WAS CONDUCTED ON A COLD, WINDY DAY WITH
PARTIAL SNOW COVER.

ATTACHMENTS

PHOTOS OF THIS SITE WERE TAKEN AND PLACED ON FILE.

DAVID W. HACKFORD 2/15/05, 10:15 AM
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE

ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETERS

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: NONE

FLORA/FAUNA: SAGEBRUSH, SHADSCALE, PRICKLEY PEAR, CHEAT GRASS, HORSE

BRUSH: PRONGHORN, COYOTES, SONGBIRDS, RAPTORS, RODENTS, RABBITS.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: LIGHT BROWN SANDY CLAY.

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: VERY LITTLE NATURAL EROSION.
SEDIMENTATION AND STABILITY ARE NOT A PROBLEM AND LOCATION CONSTRUCTION
SHOULDN'T CAUSE AN INCREASE IN STABILITY OR EROSION PROBLEMS.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: NONE OBSERVED

RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: 100' BY 150' AND 10' DEEP.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): A PLASTIC LINER WILL

NOT BE REQUIRED FOR RESERVE PIT.

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN

AS PER SITLA.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: AS PER SITLA.

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: SITE HAS BEEN INSPECTED BY MONTGOMERY

ARCHEOLOGICAL CONSULTANTS. A REPORT OF THIS INVESTIGATION WILL BE PLACED ON

FILE.

OTHER OBSERVATIONS/COMMENTS

THIS PREDRILL INVESTIGATION WAS CONDUCTED ON A COLD, WINDY DAY WITH
PARTIAL SNOW COVER.

ATTACHMENTS

PHOTOS OF THIS SITE WERE TAKEN AND PLACED ON FILE.

DAVID W. HACKFORD 2/15/05, 10:15 AM
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE



Mation Ranking Criteria and Ranking S
For Reserve and onsite Pit Liner Requirements

Site-Specific Factors Ranking Site Ranking

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
>200 0
100 to 200 5
75 to 100 10
25 to 75 15
<25 or recharge area 20 ___5

Distance to Surf. Water (feet)
>1000 0
300 to 1000 2
200 to 300 10
100 to 200 15
< 100 20 0

Distance to Nearest Municipal
Well (feet)

>5280 0
1320 to 5280 5
500 to 1320 10
<500 20 0

Distance to Other Wells (feet)
>1320 0
300 to 1320 10
<300 20 0

Native Soil Type
Low permeability 0
Mod. permeability 10
High permeability 20 0

Fluid Type
Air/mist 0
Fresh Water 5
TDS >5000 and <10000 10
TDS >10000 or Oil Base Mud Fluid 15

containing significant levels of
hazardous constituents 20 5

Drill Cuttings
Normal Rock O
Salt or detrimental 10 0

Annual Precipitation (inches)
<10 0
10 to 20 5
>20 10 0

Affected Populations
<10 0
10 to 30 6
30 to 50 8
>50 10 0

Presence of Nearby Utility
Conduits

Not Present 0
Unknown 10
Present 15 0

Final Score 10 (Level III Sensitivity)

Sensitivity Level I = 20 or more; total containment is required.
Sensitivity Izvel II = 15-19; lining is discretionary.
Sensitivity Level III = below 15; no specific lining is required
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

STATEMENT OF BASIS

OPERATOR: WESTPORT OIL AND GAS COMPANY, L.P.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: LOVE 1121-16B
API NUMBER: 43-047-36254
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NW/NE See:_1_6TWP: llS RNG: 21E 1630' FEL 648' FNL

Geology/Ground Water:

Westport proposes to set 1,900' of surface casing at this location. The depth to the base of the moderately
saline water at this location is estimated to be at a depth of 4,000'. A search of Division of Water Rights records
shows no water wells within a 10,000 foot radius of the proposed location. The surface formation at this site is
the Uinta Formation. The Uinta Formation is made up of interbedded shales and sandstones. The sandstones
are mostly lenticular and discontinuous and should not be a significant source of useable ground water.

Reviewer: Brad Hill Date: 02/24/05

Surface:

The predrill investigation of the surface was performed on 2/15/05. Floyd Bartlett with DWR and Ed Bonner with
SITLA were invited to this investigation on 1/25/05. Mr. Bartlett was present. He did not have any concerns
regarding the construction of this location or the drilling of the well. This site is on State surface with State
minerals. This site appears to be the best site for a location in the immediate area. Mr. Bartlett wrote and presented
Mr. Estes (Westport) a seed mix recommendation to be used when reserve pit is reclaimed, and to be used when and
if location and access road is reclaimed..

Reviewer: David W. Hackford Date: 2/16/05

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:
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Well name: 03-05 Westport Love 1121-16B
Operator: Westport Oil & Gas
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-047-36254
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 102 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: 541 ft

Burst
x anticipated surface
pressure: 1,672 psi

Internal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 1,900 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 8,800 ft
Tension is based on buoyed weight. Next mud weight: 10.000 ppg
Neutral point: 1,666 ft Next setting BHP: 4,571 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 1,900 ft
Injection pressure 1,900 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (fta)

1 1900 9.625 32.30 H-40 ST&C 1900 1900 8.876 120.4

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 829 1370 1.653 1900 2270 1.19 54 254 4.72 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5280 Date: March 2,2005
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX:801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 1900 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe that of the

Well name: 03-05 Westport Love 1121-16B
Operator: Westport Oil & Gas
String type: Surface Project ID:
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Well name: 03-05 Westport Love 1121-16B
Operator: Westport Oil & Gas
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-047-36254
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 102 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: 541 ft

Burst
x anticipated surface
pressure: 1,672 psi
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Calculated BHP 1,900 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 8,800 ft
Tension is based on buoyed weight. Next mud weight: 10.000 ppg
Neutral point: 1,666 ft Next setting BHP: 4,571 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 1,900 ft
Injection pressure 1,900 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (fta)

1 1900 9.625 32.30 H-40 ST&C 1900 1900 8.876 120.4

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 829 1370 1.653 1900 2270 1.19 54 254 4.72 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5280 Date: March 2,2005
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining FAX:801-359-3940 Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 1900 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe that of the



Well name: 03-05 Westport Love 1121-16B
Operator: Westport Oil & Gas
String type: Production Project ID:

43-047-36254
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 10.000 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 75 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 198 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 1,500 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
x anticipated surface
pressure: 3,515 psi

Internal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 4,571 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on buoyed weight.
Neutral point: 7,484 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 8800 4.5 11.60 N-80 LT&C 8800 8800 3.875 204

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 4571 6350 1.389 4571 7780 1.70 87 223 2.57 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Phone: 801-538-5280 Date: March 2,2005
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WESTPORT OIL AND GAS COMPANY, L.P.

1999 Broadway Suite 3700 Denver, Colorado 80202
Telephone: 303 296 3600 Fax: 303 296 3601

November 8, 2005

Ms. Diana Whitney
Division of Oil, Gasand Mining
P.O.Box 145801
Salt Lake City,UT 84114-6100

RE: LoveUnit 1121-16B
TllS-R21E
Section 16: NWNE
648' FNL, 1,630' FEL
Uintah County,Utah

Dear Ms. Whitney:

Westport Oil and Gas Company,L.P. has submitted a pennit to drill the captioned well to testthe Wasatch and Mesaverde formations. The well is located at an exception location to StateRule 649-3-2 (State Wide). The well locationwas moved for topograplúc reasons. Westportowns 100% of the leasehold within 460 feet of the exception location of the offset lands andhas no objection to the exception location.

Westportrequests your approval of this exception location. If you have any questions, call meat 720-264-2618. Thank you for your assistance.

Sincerely,

W. ChrisLatimer, CPL
SeniorLandman

ec: Raleen
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JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

GARY R. HERBERT
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah November 15, 2005

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director Westport Oil & Gas Company LP

1368 South 1200 East
Division of Vernal, UT 84078

Oil, Gas & Mining

JOHN R. BAZA
Division Director Re: Love 1121-16B Well, 648' FNL, 1630' FEL, NW NE, Sec. 16, T. 11 South,

R. 21 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

Appropriate information has been submitted to DOGM and administrative
approval of the requested exception location is hereby granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36254.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

mf
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
SITLA

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City,UT 84114-5801
telephone(801)538-5340•facsimile (801)359-3940•TTY (801)538-7458
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Operator: Westport Oil & Gas Company LP
Well Name & Number Love 1121-16B
API Number: 43-047-36254
Lease: ML-22347-A

Location: NW NE Sec. 16 T. 11 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for Permit to Drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:

• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
• 24 hours prior to spudding the well
• within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
• prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

• Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

5. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy
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43-047-36254
November 15, 2005

6. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns)
have not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
"Board"). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion ofits
analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon
which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

2. CDW

X Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/6/2006
FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2115-Westport Oil & Gas Co., LP N2995-Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP

1368 South 1200 East 1368 South 1200 East
Vernal, UT 84078 Vernal, UT 84078

Phone: 1-(435) 781-7024 Phone: 1-(435) 781-7024

CA No. Unit:
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 5/10/2006
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 5/10/2006
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 3/7/2006
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 1355743-0181

4b. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:
Sa. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a

5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 3/27/2006 BIA not yet

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 3/27/2006

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 5/15/2006
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 5/15/2006
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 5/15/2006
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 5/16/2006
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on:
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a Name Change Only
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: COl203
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: RLBOOO5239
3. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number RLBOOO5236
a. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a rider added KMG

The Division sent response by letter on:
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 5/16/2006
COMMENTS:

KMG (Westport) FORM A.xis
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of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 5/16/2006
COMMENTS:

KMG (Westport) FORM A.xis



Form 3 160-5 UNITED STATES FCEM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. looul35

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR E.xpimsJnovember30,2000

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTS ONWELLS MULTIPLELEASES
Do not use thIs form for proposals to drlII or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD)for such proposals.

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side

1. Type of Well

O oil well U Gas Well Other 8. Well Nameand No.
2. Nameof0perator MUTIPLE WELLS
KERR-McGEEO/L &GAS ONSHORELP 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL,UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T. R. M, or Survey Description)

11. County or Parish, State
SEE ATTACHED

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Q Acidize Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

O Alter Casing Fracture Treat O acciamation Wen Integrity
Subsequent Report Q Casing Repair New Construction O Recomplete Other CHANGE OF

O Change Plans Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon OPERATOR
O Final Abandonment Notice O Convert to Injection Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperations(cleady state all pertinentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdate of anyproposedworkandapproximatedurationthereof -

If the proposal is to deepen directionallyor recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinentmarkets and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performedor providethe BondNo on file with BLM/BIA Requiredsubsequentreports shall be filed within30 days
followingcompletionof the involvedoperations. If the operation resultsin a multiplecompletionor recompletionin a new interval,a Form31664 shall befiledonce
testing has been completed. FinalAbandonmentNoticesshall be filed only after all requirements,includingreclamation, have been completed,and the operatorhas
determinedthat the site isreadyfor finalinspection.

PLEASE BE ADVISED THAT KERR-McGEE OIL &GAS ONSHORE LP, IS CONSIDERED TO BE THE RECElVED
OPERATOR OF THE ATTACHED WELL LOCATIONS. EFFECTIVE JANUARY 6, 2006.
KERR-McGEE OlL & GAS ONSHORE LP, IS RESPONSIBLE UNDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS MAYl 0 2008
OF THE LEASE(S) FOR THE OPERATIONS CONDUCTED UPON LEASELANDS. BOND COVERAGE
IS PROVIDED BY STATE OF UTAH NATIONWIDEBOND NO.RLBOOO5237. Div OFOIL,GAS&MINING

um som - awaas APPROVEDJ L6

Na rinted/1pped) Title EarleneRussell,EngineeringTechnlolan
Y AY DRILLINGMANAGER

ture / Date
May 9, 2006

I THISSPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATEUSE
Approved by Title Date

Conditiom of apploval, ifany, are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or Office
certify thatthe applicant holds legal or equitable title to thoselights in the subject lease
which would entitle theapplicant toconduct operationsthereon.
Title 18 U.S.C.Section 1001,make ita crime forany personknowinglyand willfullyto make to any departmentor agencyof theUnitedStatesany
false,fictitiousorfraudulentstatementsorrepresentationsas to anymatterwithinitsjurisdiction.

(Instructions on
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determinedthat the site isready for finalinspection.

EFFECTIVE JANUARY 6, 2006, WESTPORT OIL & GAS COMPANY LP., HAS RELINQUISHED
THE OPERATORSHIP OF THE ATTACHEIDW IL& GAS

REA1El/ED
DivisionofOlt,GasandMining
BarleneRussell,EngineeringMielas to nF 016GAS? MININQ14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed/Typed) Title
BRAD LANEY ENGINEERING SPECIALIST
Signature Date

May 9, 2006
THISSPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATEUSE

Ap ed by Title Date

Cotditiom ofappro ifa
,
are Approval of thisnotice Ñesnot warrant or Office

certify thatthe applicant holdsleg equitable titleto those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle theapplicant to conduct operationsthereon.
Title 18U.S.C.Section 1001,make it a crime forany personknowinglyand willfully to maketo any departmentor agencyofthe UnitedStatesany
false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsas to anymatterwithinitsjurisdiction.
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP

Well Name: LOVE 1121-16B

Api No: 43-047-36254 Lease Type: STATE

Section 16 Township 11S Range 21E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor PETE MARTIN'S RIG # BUCKET

SPUDDED:
Date 06/29/06

Time 12:00 NOON

How DRY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by LOU WELDON

Telephone # (435) 828-7035

Date 06/30/2006 Signed
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sTATEOf URH OPERATOR KERR-MCGEEOil & GAS ONSHORE LP OPERATORACCT.NO. N N2995
OMSION OF at. MS MD MMNG ADDRESS 1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST
ENTITYACTIONFORM-FORM6 VERNAL,UTAH84078

ACTl0N CURRENT NEW APINUMBER WELLNAME WELLLOCATION SPUC EFFECTIVE
CODE ENTlTYNO. ENTITYNŒ 00 SC TP RG COUNTY DATE DATE

99999 4304737219 NBU 1022-20N SESW 20 10S 22E UINTAH 6/2912006

WELL1COMMENTS:
MKRU BUCKET RIG SPUD WELL @1800 HRS 6/29/0
SET 40' 14" SCHEDULE 10 PIPE
BIbi & STATENOTIFIED OF SPUD
ACTION CURRENT NEW APtNUMBER WELLNAME MLLLOCATION SPUD EFFECTIVE

o CODE ENHTYNO. ENTHYNO. 00 SC TP RG COUN1Y DATE DATE
A 99999 LOVE II21-l6B NWNE 16 llS 21E UINTAR 6/2912006

/1 î7 gegna r '7/6/4
WELL2 COMMENTS
MIRU BUCKET RIG SPUDWELL@1200HRS 6/29/& V

DRILL & SET 40' 14°'SCHEDULE10PIPE '
BLM & STATE NOTIFIED OF SPUD.

ACTION CURRENT NEW APINUMBER WELLNAME WELLLOCAT SPUD EFFECTIVE
COCE ENETYNO. ENitTYNO. 00 SC 1P RG COUM1Y DATE DATE

LL.
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o
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o CODE ENTITYRO. ENTHYNO. 00 SC TP RG COUNTY DATE DATE
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CODE ENTITYNO. ENTRYNŒ 00 SC 1P RG COUNTY DATE DATE

WELL5COMMENTS -, u.

Post-It' Fax Note 7671 Date
¯ Ng>

ACTIONCODES(Seeinstmcíansonbackofform} T From

A - Estabishnewenityfornewwell(singlewel
B - Addnewwelltoexisingenity(gouporutil il
C-Regwelfromoneexisingenlitytoan gÛ
D - Reassign wellfromoneexisingentitytoa Fax y Fax s REGULATORY CLERK 06/30/06

E - Othet(explainincommentssection) lille Date

NOTE:Use COMMENTsectiontoexplainwhyeachAl

gg) PhoneNa
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WELL1COMMENTS:
MKRU BUCKET RIG SPUD WELL @1800 HRS 6/29/0
SET 40' 14" SCHEDULE 10 PIPE
BIbi & STATENOTIFIED OF SPUD
ACTION CURRENT NEW APtNUMBER WELLNAME MLLLOCATION SPUD EFFECTIVE

o CODE ENHTYNO. ENTHYNO. 00 SC TP RG COUN1Y DATE DATE
A 99999 LOVE II21-l6B NWNE 16 llS 21E UINTAR 6/2912006

/1 î7 gegna r '7/6/4
WELL2 COMMENTS
MIRU BUCKET RIG SPUDWELL@1200HRS 6/29/& V

DRILL & SET 40' 14°'SCHEDULE10PIPE '
BLM & STATE NOTIFIED OF SPUD.

ACTION CURRENT NEW APINUMBER WELLNAME WELLLOCAT SPUD EFFECTIVE
COCE ENETYNO. ENitTYNO. 00 SC 1P RG COUM1Y DATE DATE

LL.

WELL3COMMENTS:

o
- ACTION CURRENT NEW APINUMBER WEtì NAME WELLLOCATION SPUO EFFECTWE
o CODE ENTITYRO. ENTHYNO. 00 SC TP RG COUNTY DATE DATE

© WELL4COMMENTS:

ACTION CURRENT NEW APINUMBER MLLNAME WELLLOCATION SPUD EFFECTIVE
CODE ENTITYNO. ENTRYNŒ 00 SC 1P RG COUNTY DATE DATE

WELL5COMMENTS -, u.

Post-It' Fax Note 7671 Date
¯ Ng>

ACTIONCODES(Seeinstmcíansonbackofform} T From

A - Estabishnewenityfornewwell(singlewel
B - Addnewwelltoexisingenity(gouporutil il
C-Regwelfromoneexisingenlitytoan gÛ
D - Reassign wellfromoneexisingentitytoa Fax y Fax s REGULATORY CLERK 06/30/06

E - Othet(explainincommentssection) lille Date

NOTE:Use COMMENTsectiontoexplainwhyeachAl

gg) PhoneNa



STATEOFUTAH FORMS

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

ML-22347-A
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B
2 NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL AND GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST a VERNAL UT ,84078 (435) 781-7003 UNDESIGNATED

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648' FNL 1630' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21 E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASlNG FRACTURE TREAT SlDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will Start; CASING REPAlR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARlLY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DlŠPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUClNG FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: SPUD

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

MlRU PETE MARTIN DRILLING-BUCKETRIG. DRILLED20" CONDUCTOR HOLE TO 40'. RAN 14" 36.7# SCHEDULE 10

PIPE. CMT Wl28 SX READY MIX. SPUD WELL @ 1200 HR, 6/29/06.

NAME(PLEAS INT) RAMEYHOOPES TITLE REGULATORY CLERK

SIGNATURE DATE
6/30/2006

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
JUL2 5

STATEOFUTAH FORMS

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

ML-22347-A
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B
2 NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL AND GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST a VERNAL UT ,84078 (435) 781-7003 UNDESIGNATED

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648' FNL 1630' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21 E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASlNG FRACTURE TREAT SlDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will Start; CASING REPAlR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARlLY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DlŠPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUClNG FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: SPUD

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

MlRU PETE MARTIN DRILLING-BUCKETRIG. DRILLED20" CONDUCTOR HOLE TO 40'. RAN 14" 36.7# SCHEDULE 10

PIPE. CMT Wl28 SX READY MIX. SPUD WELL @ 1200 HR, 6/29/06.

NAME(PLEAS INT) RAMEYHOOPES TITLE REGULATORY CLERK

SIGNATURE DATE
6/30/2006

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
JUL2 5

STATEOFUTAH FORMS

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

ML-22347-A
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B
2 NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL AND GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST a VERNAL UT ,84078 (435) 781-7003 UNDESIGNATED

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648' FNL 1630' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21 E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASlNG FRACTURE TREAT SlDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will Start; CASING REPAlR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARlLY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DlŠPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUClNG FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: SPUD

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

MlRU PETE MARTIN DRILLING-BUCKETRIG. DRILLED20" CONDUCTOR HOLE TO 40'. RAN 14" 36.7# SCHEDULE 10

PIPE. CMT Wl28 SX READY MIX. SPUD WELL @ 1200 HR, 6/29/06.

NAME(PLEAS INT) RAMEYHOOPES TITLE REGULATORY CLERK

SIGNATURE DATE
6/30/2006

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
JUL2 5



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML22347-A
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form forsuch proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. AP1 NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OILAND GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL sy,,, UT »,84078 (435) 781-7003 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648' FNL 1630' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAlR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARiLYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREV10US PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAlR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: SET SURF CSG

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

MIRUBILL JR'S RATHOLE DRILLINGON 7/2/06. DRILLED 12 1/4" SURFACE HOLE TO 1940'. RAN 9 5/8" 46 JTS
H-40 32.3#. TAILED CMT Wl200 SX PREM CLASS G @ 15.8 PPG 1.15 YIELD. TOP OUT Wl150 SX CLASS G @ 15.38 PPG
1.15 YlELD. GOOD CMT TO SURFACE ANDSTAYED AT SURFACE. WORT.

MN

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) JUL 2 3

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML22347-A
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form forsuch proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. AP1 NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OILAND GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL sy,,, UT »,84078 (435) 781-7003 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648' FNL 1630' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAlR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARiLYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREV10US PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAlR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: SET SURF CSG

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

MIRUBILL JR'S RATHOLE DRILLINGON 7/2/06. DRILLED 12 1/4" SURFACE HOLE TO 1940'. RAN 9 5/8" 46 JTS
H-40 32.3#. TAILED CMT Wl200 SX PREM CLASS G @ 15.8 PPG 1.15 YIELD. TOP OUT Wl150 SX CLASS G @ 15.38 PPG
1.15 YlELD. GOOD CMT TO SURFACE ANDSTAYED AT SURFACE. WORT.

MN

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) JUL 2 3

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML22347-A
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form forsuch proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. AP1 NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OILAND GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL sy,,, UT »,84078 (435) 781-7003 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648' FNL 1630' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAlR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARiLYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREV10US PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAlR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: SET SURF CSG

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

MIRUBILL JR'S RATHOLE DRILLINGON 7/2/06. DRILLED 12 1/4" SURFACE HOLE TO 1940'. RAN 9 5/8" 46 JTS
H-40 32.3#. TAILED CMT Wl200 SX PREM CLASS G @ 15.8 PPG 1.15 YIELD. TOP OUT Wl150 SX CLASS G @ 15.38 PPG
1.15 YlELD. GOOD CMT TO SURFACE ANDSTAYED AT SURFACE. WORT.

MN

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) JUL 2 3



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRlBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, signifcantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillholizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL / OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of wod completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: FINAL DRILLING
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPE RATIONS

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

FINISHED DRILLING FROM 1940' TO 8700' ON 07/24/2006. RAN 4 1/2" 11.6# I-80 PRODUCTION CSG. LEAD CMT Wl381
SX PREM LITE II @11.5PPG 2.82 YIELD. TAILED CMT Wl1258 SX 50/50 POZ @14.3PPG 1.31 YIELD. 134.4 BBLS
DISPLACEMENT BUMP PLUG FLOATS HELD. SET SLIPS Wl80K CLEAN PITS RAISE STACK ROUGH CUT CSG.

RELEASED PIONEER RIG 53 ON 07/26/2006 AT 0400 HRS.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) S EILA UPCH GO TITLE
REGULATORY ANALYST

SIGNATURE DATE 7/28/2006

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
AUSU1 2006

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML-22347-A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRlBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, signifcantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillholizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL / OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of wod completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: FINAL DRILLING
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPE RATIONS

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

FINISHED DRILLING FROM 1940' TO 8700' ON 07/24/2006. RAN 4 1/2" 11.6# I-80 PRODUCTION CSG. LEAD CMT Wl381

SX PREM LITE II @11.5PPG 2.82 YIELD. TAILED CMT Wl1258 SX 50/50 POZ @14.3PPG 1.31 YIELD. 134.4 BBLS
DISPLACEMENT BUMP PLUG FLOATS HELD. SET SLIPS Wl80K CLEAN PITS RAISE STACK ROUGH CUT CSG.

RELEASED PIONEER RIG 53 ON 07/26/2006 AT 0400 HRS.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) S EILA UPCH GO TITLE
REGULATORY ANALYST

SIGNATURE DATE 7/28/2006

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
AUSU1 2006

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML-22347-A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRlBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, signifcantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillholizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAME and NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL / OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of wod completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: FINAL DRILLING
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPE RATIONS

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

FINISHED DRILLING FROM 1940' TO 8700' ON 07/24/2006. RAN 4 1/2" 11.6# I-80 PRODUCTION CSG. LEAD CMT Wl381

SX PREM LITE II @11.5PPG 2.82 YIELD. TAILED CMT Wl1258 SX 50/50 POZ @14.3PPG 1.31 YIELD. 134.4 BBLS
DISPLACEMENT BUMP PLUG FLOATS HELD. SET SLIPS Wl80K CLEAN PITS RAISE STACK ROUGH CUT CSG.

RELEASED PIONEER RIG 53 ON 07/26/2006 AT 0400 HRS.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) S EILA UPCH GO TITLE
REGULATORY ANALYST

SIGNATURE DATE 7/28/2006

(This space for State use only)
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML-22347-A
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UN]TOr CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1.TYPEOFWELL 8.\NELLNAMEandNUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL& GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDlAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL

(Submit Original Form Only)
CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: PRODU CTION
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

START-UP

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THE SUBJECT WELL LOCATION WAS PLACED ON PRODUCTION ON 08/23/2006 AT 9:30 AM.

PLEASE REFER TO THE ATTACHED CHRONOLOGICAL WELL HISTORY.

NAME P
UPCH TT E REGULOA6TORYANALYST

(This space for State use only)

AUS2 8 2006
(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse
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KERR MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, LP

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

LOVE 1121-16B

SPUD Surface Casing Activity Status

Air Rig

06/12/06 Build Location, 5% complete Pioneer53

6/13/06 Build Location, 10% complete PioneerB3

6/14/06 Build Location, 15% complete Pioneers

6/19/06 Build Location, 15% complete Pioneer53

6/20/06 Build Location, 20% complete PioneerS3

6/21/06 Build Location, 25% complete Pioneer53

6/22/06 Build Location, 30% complete PioneerB3

6/23/06 Build Location, 40% complete Pioneers3

6/26/06 Ruild Location, 60% complete PioneerS3

6/27/06 Build Location, 80% complete Pioneer53

6/28/06 Build Location, 90% complete Pioneer53

6/29/06 Location Complete Pioneer53

7/05/06 6/26/06 Set Conductor PioneerB3
7/2/06 9 5/8" @1932' Air Rig Spud, WORT, Ring In

07/13/06 TD: 1940' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 8.3 SD: 7/XX/06 DSS: 0
Move to Love 1121-16B. Spot rig. SDFN.

07/14/06 TD: 1940' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 8.3 SD: 7/XX/06 DSS: 0
Spot rig. RURT.

07/17/06 TD: 4675' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 8.4 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 2
Finish RURT. NU and test BOPE. PU BHA and DP. Drill FE. Drill from 1940'-4675'.
Circulate out gas and mud up @report time.

07/18/06 TD: 5350' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 9.4 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 3
Circulate hole and repair rig. Work on SCR. Drill from 4675'-5350'. DA @report time.

07/19/06 TD: 6230' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 9.6 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 4
Drill from 5350'-6230'. DA @ report

KERR MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, LP

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

LOVE 1121-16B

SPUD Surface Casing Activity Status

Air Rig

06/12/06 Build Location, 5% complete Pioneer53

6/13/06 Build Location, 10% complete PioneerB3

6/14/06 Build Location, 15% complete Pioneers

6/19/06 Build Location, 15% complete Pioneer53

6/20/06 Build Location, 20% complete PioneerS3

6/21/06 Build Location, 25% complete Pioneer53

6/22/06 Build Location, 30% complete PioneerB3

6/23/06 Build Location, 40% complete Pioneers3

6/26/06 Ruild Location, 60% complete PioneerS3

6/27/06 Build Location, 80% complete Pioneer53

6/28/06 Build Location, 90% complete Pioneer53

6/29/06 Location Complete Pioneer53

7/05/06 6/26/06 Set Conductor PioneerB3

7/2/06 9 5/8" @1932' Air Rig Spud, WORT, Ring In

07/13/06 TD: 1940' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 8.3 SD: 7/XX/06 DSS: 0
Move to Love 1121-16B. Spot rig. SDFN.

07/14/06 TD: 1940' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 8.3 SD: 7/XX/06 DSS: 0
Spot rig. RURT.

07/17/06 TD: 4675' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 8.4 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 2
Finish RURT. NU and test BOPE. PU BHA and DP. Drill FE. Drill from 1940'-4675'.
Circulate out gas and mud up @report time.

07/18/06 TD: 5350' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 9.4 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 3
Circulate hole and repair rig. Work on SCR. Drill from 4675'-5350'. DA @report time.

07/19/06 TD: 6230' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 9.6 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 4

Drill from 5350'-6230'. DA @ report

KERR MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, LP

CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

LOVE 1121-16B

SPUD Surface Casing Activity Status

Air Rig

06/12/06 Build Location, 5% complete Pioneer53

6/13/06 Build Location, 10% complete PioneerB3

6/14/06 Build Location, 15% complete Pioneers

6/19/06 Build Location, 15% complete Pioneer53

6/20/06 Build Location, 20% complete PioneerS3

6/21/06 Build Location, 25% complete Pioneer53

6/22/06 Build Location, 30% complete PioneerB3

6/23/06 Build Location, 40% complete Pioneers3

6/26/06 Ruild Location, 60% complete PioneerS3

6/27/06 Build Location, 80% complete Pioneer53

6/28/06 Build Location, 90% complete Pioneer53

6/29/06 Location Complete Pioneer53

7/05/06 6/26/06 Set Conductor PioneerB3

7/2/06 9 5/8" @1932' Air Rig Spud, WORT, Ring In

07/13/06 TD: 1940' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 8.3 SD: 7/XX/06 DSS: 0
Move to Love 1121-16B. Spot rig. SDFN.

07/14/06 TD: 1940' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 8.3 SD: 7/XX/06 DSS: 0
Spot rig. RURT.

07/17/06 TD: 4675' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 8.4 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 2
Finish RURT. NU and test BOPE. PU BHA and DP. Drill FE. Drill from 1940'-4675'.
Circulate out gas and mud up @report time.

07/18/06 TD: 5350' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 9.4 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 3
Circulate hole and repair rig. Work on SCR. Drill from 4675'-5350'. DA @report time.

07/19/06 TD: 6230' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 9.6 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 4

Drill from 5350'-6230'. DA @ report



07/20/06 TD: 7111' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 10.0 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 5
Drill from 6230'-7111'. DA @report time.

07/21/06 TD: 7839' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 10.0 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 6
Drill from 7111'-7839', Work on SCR. DA @ report time.

07/24/06 TD: 8700' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 12.0 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 9
Drill from 7839'-8021'. TFNB. Work through tight hole @4877'. FIH. Drill to 8693..
Work on SCR, 15 hrs. Drill to 8700' TD. CCH. POOH for logs @ report time.

07/25/06 TD: 8700' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 12.1 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 10
POOH for logs. Run Triple Combo, bridged out @5320'. Log out. TIH with drill string
and CCH for casing. Lay down drill string @report time.

07/26/06 TD: 8700' Csg. 9 5/8" @1932' MW: 12.1 SD: 7/15/06 DSS: 11
Finish LDDS. Run and cmt 4.5" prod csg. Set slips, NDBOP, cut csg, and clean pits.
Released rig at 0400 hrs on 7/26/06. RDRT @report time.

08/14/06 PROG: 7:00 AM HSM.
RIG UP RIG. ND WELL HEAD, NU BOP'S, PU 3 7/8" MILL & SUB. RIH W/253 JTS OF 2
3/8" J-55 4.7# TBG. NEW TUBING. CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN W/ 2% KCL WATER.
POOH W/253 JTS. ND BOP'S NU FRAC VALVES. SWI SDFN

08/15/06 PROG: 7:00 AM. HSM
MIRU B&C QUICK TEST TO TEST CASING & FRAC VALVES.
TEST CASING & BOTH FRAC VALVES TO 7,500 PSI. GOOD TEST.
RDMO B&C QUICK TEST
MIRU CUTTERS TO PERFORATE ZONE 1.
RIH W/ 3 3/8 EXP GUNS, 23 GRM, .35 HOLES, 90 DEG PHASING
PERFORATE 8,316' - 23' 4 SPF, 8,204' - 08' 4 SPF, 42 HOLES.
RDMO CUTTERS. REPLACE DRILLING LINE ON RIG. SWI SDFN

08/16/06 PROG: WELL ON STANDBY.
DC: $896,046 P/L FAC: $35,270 COMP C: $49,831 CWC: $981,147

08/17/06 PROG: RIG ON STANDBY.

08/18/06 PROG: 6:00 AM. HSM. MIRU SCHLUMBERGER & CUTTERS TO FRAC & PERFORATE
PRESSURE TEST PUMPS & LINES TO 8,571 PSI GOOD TEST.

STG l ) WHP 90 PSI, BRK 3,662 PSI, @5.3 BPM, ISIP 2340 PSI, FG .72 PUMP 100 BBLS @
49.5 BPM @4,900 PSI, = 42 OF 42 HOLES OPEN MP 6,974 PSI, MR 51.9 BPM, AP 4,843
PSI, AR 48.0 BPM, ISIP 3,236 PSI, FG .83 NPI 896 PSI, PMP 1,603 BBLS SLICK WATER,
45,900 # 30/50 SAND, & 5,000 # 20/40 RESIN COATED SAND

STG 2 ) RIH W/ 3 3/8" EXP GUNS, 23 GRM, .35 HOLES 90 & 120 DEG PHASING SET 8K
BAKER CBP @8,132' & PERF 8,101' - 07' 4 SPF, 8,085' - 89' 3 SPF 7,978' - 81' 3 SPF, 45
HOLES. WHP O PSI. BRK 3,777 PSI, @5.3 BPM, ISIP 2,812 PSI, FG .79 PUMP 100 BBLS

@50.5 BPM @5,400 PSI, = 42 OF 45 HOLES OPEN MP 5,721 PSI, MR 51.7 BPM, AP 4,765
PSI, AR 51.0 BPM, ISIP 2,851 PSI, FG .79 NPI 39 PSI, PMP 806 BBLS SLICK WATER,
22,700 # 30/50 SAND, & 5,000 # 20/40 RESIN COATED SAND

STG 3 ) RIH W/ 3 3/8" EXP GUNS, 23 GRM, .35 HOLES 90 & 120 DEG PHASING SET 8K
BAKER CBP @7,614' & PERF 7,579' - 84' 4 SPF, 7,397' - 7,405' 3 SPF 44 HOLES. WHP O
PSI. BRK 3,499 PSI, @5.3 BPM, ISIP 1,877 PSI, FG .67 PUMP 100 BBLS @51 BPM @
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PSI, = 41 OF 44 HOLES OPEN MP 5,251 PSI, MR 53.3 BPM, AP 4,086 PSI, AR 51.2 BPM,
ISIP 2,583 PSI, FG .76NPI 706 PSI, PMP 794 BBLS SLICK WATER, 23,900 # 30/50 SAND,
&5,000 # 20/40 RESIN COATED SAND

STG 4 ) RIH W/ 3 3/8" EXP GUNS, 23 GRM, .35 HOLES 90 DEG PHASING SET 8K BAKER
CBP @7,219' & PERF 7,185' - 89' 4 SPF, 6,925'- 6,931'4 SPF 40 HOLES. WHP O PSI. BRK
3,985 PSI, @5.3 BPM, ISIP 2,112 PSI, FG .74 PUMP 100 BBLS @50 BPM @4,738 PSI, = 39
OF 40 HOLES OPEN MP 4,985 PSI, MR 50.5 BPM, AP 3,997 PSI, AR 49.6 BPM, ISIP 2,690
PSI, FG .82 NPI 578 PSI, PMP 778 BBLS SLICK WATER, 22,000 # 30/50 SAND, &5,000 #
20/40 RESIN COATED SAND

STG 5 ) RIH W/ 3 3/8" EXP GUNS, 23 GRM, .35 HOLES 90 DEG PHASING SET 8K BAKER
CBP @6,736' & PERF 6,696' - 6,706'4 SPF, 40 HOLES. WHP O PSI. BRK 2,881 PSI, @5.3
BPM, ISIP 1,776 PSI, FG .70 PUMP 100 BBLS @50.1 BPM @4,380 PSI, = 40 OF 40 HOLES
OPEN MP 4,702 PSI, MR 50.7 BPM, AP 3,635 PSI, AR 49.8 BPM, ISIP 2,420 PSI, FG .80

NPI 644 PSI, PMP 825 BBLS SLICK WATER, 26,600 # 30/50 SAND, & 5,000 # 20/40 RESIN
COATED SAND

STG 6 ) RIH W/ 3 3/8" EXP GUNS, 23 GRM, .35 HOLES 90 DEG PHASING SET 8K BAKER
CBP @6,574' & PERF 6,534' - 6,544', 4 SPF, 40 HOLES. WHP O PSI. BRK 3,798 PSI, @5.3
BPM, ISIP 2,205 PSI, FG .77 PUMP 100 BBLS @50.2 BPM @4,700 PSI, = 30 OF 40 HOLES
OPEN SAND WAS RUN ON A STEP NOT A RAMP BECAUSE OF BLENDER MP 5,724 PSI,
MR 51.5 BPM, AP 4,601 PSI, AR 49.8 BPM, ISIP 3,627 PSI, FG .98NPI 1,422 PSI, PMP
864 BBLS SLICK WATER, 27,660 # 30/50 SAND, &5,000 # 20/40 RESIN COATED SAND

KILL PLG ) RIH W/ 8K BAKER CBP SET @6,460'
RDMO SCHLUMBERGER & CUTTERS
ND FRAC VALVES NU BOP'S SWI SDFN 8:30 PM

8/19/06 PROG: 7:00 AM HSM. PU 3 7/8" BIT POBS & SN. RIH W/ 204 JTS OF 2 3/8" J-55

4.7# TBG. RU POWER SWIVEL & BRK CIRCULATION. RIH
C/O 10' OF SAND TAG PLG 1 @6,460' DRL PLG IN 10 MIN 100 PSI INCREASE RIH
C/O 30' OF SAND TAG PLG 2 @6,574' DRL PLG IN 10 MIN 500 PSI INCREASE RIH
C/O 30' OF SAND TAG PLG 3 @6,736' DRL PLG IN 10 MIN 400 PSI INCREASE RIH
C/O 30' OF SAND TAG PLG 4 @7,219' DRL PLG IN 10 MIN 300 PSI INCREASE RIH
C/O 30' OF SAND TAG PLG 5 @7,614' DRL PLG IN 10 MIN 500 PSI INCREASE RIH
C/O 30' OF SAND TAG PLG 6 @8,132' DRL PLG IN 10 MIN 400 PSI INCREASE RIH
C/O TO 8,446.22' PBTD. CIRCULATE CLEAN POOH LD 32 JTS. LAND TBG W/ 235
JTS EOT @7,441.40'. ND BOP'S NU WELL HEAD DROP BALL TO SHEAR OFF BIT.
PUMP OFF BIT @2,000 PSI. TURN WELL OVER TO FLOW TESTERS.

285 JTS OUTBOUND 5,670 BBLS TOTAL LOAD
235 JTS LANDED 550 BBLS RIG RECOVERY

50 JTS RETURNED 5,120 BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER

WELL ON FLOWBACK, FLOWBACK REPORT: CP: 900#, TP: 900#, 20/64 CHK, 40 BWPH,
19 HRS, SD: TRACE, TTL BBLS FLWD: 875 BBLS, TODAYS LTR: 5120 BBLS, LOAD REC
TODAY: 875 BBLS, REMAINING LTR: 4245 BBLS, TOTAL LOAD REC TO DATE: 1425
BBLS.

8/20/06 PROG: WELL ON FLOWBACK, FLOWBACK REPORT: CP: 1000#, TP: 1000#, 20/64
CHK, 30 BWPH, 24 HRS, SD: TRACE, TTL BBLS FLWD: 770 BBLS, TODAYS LTR: 4245
BBLS, LOAD REC TODAY: 770 BBLS, REMAINING LTR: 3475 BBLS, TOTAL LOAD REC
TO DATE: 2195

PSI, = 41 OF 44 HOLES OPEN MP 5,251 PSI, MR 53.3 BPM, AP 4,086 PSI, AR 51.2 BPM,
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C/O 10' OF SAND TAG PLG 1 @6,460' DRL PLG IN 10 MIN 100 PSI INCREASE RIH
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285 JTS OUTBOUND 5,670 BBLS TOTAL LOAD
235 JTS LANDED 550 BBLS RIG RECOVERY

50 JTS RETURNED 5,120 BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER
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8/20/06 PROG: WELL ON FLOWBACK, FLOWBACK REPORT: CP: 1000#, TP: 1000#, 20/64
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BBLS, LOAD REC TODAY: 770 BBLS, REMAINING LTR: 3475 BBLS, TOTAL LOAD REC
TO DATE: 2195



**NOTE: RECEIVED NOTICE 8/21 THAT HALF OF THIS TUBING STRING CAME FROM FACTORY
WITH COLLARS OVERTORQUED.**

08/21/06 WELL ON FLOWBACK, FLOWBACK REPORT: CP: 1300#, TP: 1100#, 20/64 CHK, 20
BWPH, 24 HRS, SD: TRACE, TTL BBLS FLWD: 590 BBLS, TODAYS LTR: 3475 BBLS,
LOAD REC TODAY: 590 BBLS, REMAINING LTR: 2885 BBLS, TOTAL LOAD REC TO
DATE: 2785 BBLS.

08/22/06 WELL ON FLOWBACK, FLOWBACK REPORT: CP: 1550#, TP: 1100#, 29/64 CHK, 16
BWPH, 24 HRS, SD: CLEAN, TTL BBLS FLWD: 432 BBLS, TODAYS LTR: 2885 BBLS,
LOAD REC TODAY: 432 BBLS, REMAINING LTR: 2453 BBLS, TOTAL LOAD REC TO
DATE: 3217 BBLS.

08/23/06 WELL ON FLOWBACK, FLOWBACK REPORT: CP: 1550#, TP: 1100#, 29/64 CHK, 16
BWPH, 24 HRS, SD: CLEAN, TTL BBLS FLWD: 432 BBLS, TODAYS LTR: 2885 BBLS,
LOAD REC TODAY: 432 BBLS, REMAINING LTR: 2453 BBLS, TOTAL LOAD REC TO
DATE: 3217 BBLS.

WELL WENT ON SALES: 08/23/2006, 9:30 A.M. 1350 MCF, 20/64 CHK, SICP: 1700 #. FTP:
1100. 33

**NOTE: RECEIVED NOTICE 8/21 THAT HALF OF THIS TUBING STRING CAME FROM FACTORY
WITH COLLARS OVERTORQUED.**
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DATE: 3217 BBLS.

08/23/06 WELL ON FLOWBACK, FLOWBACK REPORT: CP: 1550#, TP: 1100#, 29/64 CHK, 16
BWPH, 24 HRS, SD: CLEAN, TTL BBLS FLWD: 432 BBLS, TODAYS LTR: 2885 BBLS,
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STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT O FORM 8
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes)

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: OWELL WGAESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNITorCA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
NEEWL HORSZ EEP-

N RY
EFSFŸR

OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL &GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1368 S 1200 E CITY VERNAL s:ATE UT ze84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
AT SURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL NWNE 16 11S 21E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW:

12 COUNTY 13. STATE
ATTOTALDEPTH: UINTAH UTAH

14 DATESPUDDED: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATECOMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

6/29/2006 7/24/2006 8/23/2006 ABANDONED READY TO PRODUCE 2 5544'GL
18 TOTALDEPTH: MD 8,700 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 8,656 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21 DEPTH BRIDGE MD

PLUG SET:
TVD TVD TVD

22 TYPE ELECTRICANDOTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy ofeach) 23.

BLg' / / (/ppg Ñ/ŸÊË)†/T) fk-E WAS WELLCORED7 NO YES (Submit analysis)

WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submit report)

DIRECTIONALSURVEY7 NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASINGAND LINERRECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#/ft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGED TMHENTERCNEOONFSACKES VOLSWMRE
BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

20" 14" STL 36.7# 40 28

12 1/4" 9 5/8 H-40 32.3# 1,940 660

7 7/8" 4 1/2 I-80 11.6# 8,700 1639

25. TUBING RECORD

S1ZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SlZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD)

2 3/8" 7.441
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM(TVD) INTERVAL(Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) WASATCH 6,534 6,544 6,534 6,544 0.35 40 open Squeezed

(B) MESAVERDE 6,696 8,323 6,696 8,323 0.35 211 open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

6534'-6544' PMP 864 BBLS SLICK H2O &32,660#30/50 OTTOWA SD UU i i mm
6696'-8323' PMP 4806 BBLS SLICK H2O & 166,100#30/50 OTTOWA SD

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

O ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY PROD
SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON
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SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON

STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT O FORM 8
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes)

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: OWELL WGAESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNITorCA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
NEEWL HORSZ EEP-

N RY
EFSFŸR

OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL &GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1368 S 1200 E CITY VERNAL s:ATE UT ze84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
AT SURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL NWNE 16 11S 21E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW:

12 COUNTY 13. STATE
ATTOTALDEPTH: UINTAH UTAH

14 DATESPUDDED: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATECOMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

6/29/2006 7/24/2006 8/23/2006 ABANDONED READY TO PRODUCE 2 5544'GL
18 TOTALDEPTH: MD 8,700 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 8,656 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21 DEPTH BRIDGE MD

PLUG SET:
TVD TVD TVD

22 TYPE ELECTRICANDOTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copy ofeach) 23.

BLg' / / (/ppg Ñ/ŸÊË)†/T) fk-E WAS WELLCORED7 NO YES (Submit analysis)

WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submit report)

DIRECTIONALSURVEY7 NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASINGAND LINERRECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#/ft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGED TMHENTERCNEOONFSACKES VOLSWMRE
BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

20" 14" STL 36.7# 40 28

12 1/4" 9 5/8 H-40 32.3# 1,940 660

7 7/8" 4 1/2 I-80 11.6# 8,700 1639

25. TUBING RECORD

S1ZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SlZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKERSET (MD)

2 3/8" 7.441
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM(TVD) INTERVAL(Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) WASATCH 6,534 6,544 6,534 6,544 0.35 40 open Squeezed

(B) MESAVERDE 6,696 8,323 6,696 8,323 0.35 211 open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

6534'-6544' PMP 864 BBLS SLICK H2O &32,660#30/50 OTTOWA SD UU i i mm
6696'-8323' PMP 4806 BBLS SLICK H2O & 166,100#30/50 OTTOWA SD

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

O ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY PROD
SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGINGANDCEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

8/23/2006 9/12/2006 24 RATES: 0 630 160 FLOWING
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OlL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

20/64 565 1,162 RATES: 0 630 160 PROD
INTERVALB (As shown In Item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

8/23/2006 9/12/2006 24 RATES: -' 0 630 160 FLOWING
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS

20/64 565 1,162 RATES: -+ 0 630 160 PROD
INTERVALC (As shown In Item#26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU-GAS GAS/OlL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: 1NTERVAL STATUS
RATES: -+

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

SOLD
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show allimportant zones of porosity and contentsthereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushionused, time tool open, flowingand shut-inpressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (MeasuredpDepth)

WASATCH 3,842 6,631
MESAVERDE 6,631

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (Include plugg ng procedure)

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached Information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

ME P SE GO TffLE REGULATORYANALYST

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well 9 • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantlydeepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions ifproduction is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM 24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s)ofcementwere determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

8/23/2006 9/12/2006 24 RATES: 0 630 160 FLOWING
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OlL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

20/64 565 1,162 RATES: 0 630 160 PROD
INTERVALB (As shown In Item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

8/23/2006 9/12/2006 24 RATES: -' 0 630 160 FLOWING
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS

20/64 565 1,162 RATES: -+ 0 630 160 PROD
INTERVALC (As shown In Item#26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU-GAS GAS/OlL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: 1NTERVAL STATUS
RATES: -+

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

SOLD
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show allimportant zones of porosity and contentsthereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushionused, time tool open, flowingand shut-inpressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (MeasuredpDepth)

WASATCH 3,842 6,631
MESAVERDE 6,631

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (Include plugg ng procedure)

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached Information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

ME P SE GO TffLE REGULATORYANALYST

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well 9 • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantlydeepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions ifproduction is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM 24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s)ofcementwere determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

8/23/2006 9/12/2006 24 RATES: 0 630 160 FLOWING
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OlL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

20/64 565 1,162 RATES: 0 630 160 PROD
INTERVALB (As shown In Item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

8/23/2006 9/12/2006 24 RATES: -' 0 630 160 FLOWING
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS

20/64 565 1,162 RATES: -+ 0 630 160 PROD
INTERVALC (As shown In Item#26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU-GAS GAS/OlL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: 1NTERVAL STATUS
RATES: -+

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

SOLD
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show allimportant zones of porosity and contentsthereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushionused, time tool open, flowingand shut-inpressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (MeasuredpDepth)

WASATCH 3,842 6,631
MESAVERDE 6,631

35. ADDITIONALREMARK: (Include plugg ng procedure)

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached Information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

ME P SE GO TffLE REGULATORYANALYST

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well 9 • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantlydeepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completions ifproduction is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM 24: Cement Top - Show how reported top(s)ofcementwere determined (circulated (CIR),calculated (CAL), cement bond log (CBL), temperature survey (TS)).

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL& GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHlP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASlNG FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: SHUT IN
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The operator requests authorization to shut-in the subject well location. Gross production from the greater Natural Buttes area
is currently constrained at roughly 215mmcfd due to lack of export pipeline capacity. The field is capable of producing more
gas than this,which results in frequent and widespread bottlenecked areas of high line pressure. This in turn causes numerous
wells to log off of production, often requiring swab rigs to get them going again. Operating the field in this reactionary manner
is very inefficient. The operator requests authorization to shut in wells strategically to alleviate this situation and utilize the
resource more efficiently. A significant drop in production is not expected, as the field is constrained anyway. The subject well
was selected on the basis of one or more of the following factors:
*Located in a bottlenecked area; *High intervention requirement relative to gas production, *High water production
Wells will be shut in for an indefinite period. As the constrained situation continues, different wells will be selected and subject
wells willbe returned to production in order to cycle the shut-ins around the field and allow well pressures to build up and assist
with future production.

RNVC
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6D

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASEP EILA PC O
,

TITLE REGULATORY ANALYST

SIGNATU DATE 11/3/2006

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reveme

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL& GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHlP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASlNG FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: SHUT IN
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The operator requests authorization to shut-in the subject well location. Gross production from the greater Natural Buttes area
is currently constrained at roughly 215mmcfd due to lack of export pipeline capacity. The field is capable of producing more
gas than this,which results in frequent and widespread bottlenecked areas of high line pressure. This in turn causes numerous
wells to log off of production, often requiring swab rigs to get them going again. Operating the field in this reactionary manner
is very inefficient. The operator requests authorization to shut in wells strategically to alleviate this situation and utilize the
resource more efficiently. A significant drop in production is not expected, as the field is constrained anyway. The subject well
was selected on the basis of one or more of the following factors:
*Located in a bottlenecked area; *High intervention requirement relative to gas production, *High water production
Wells will be shut in for an indefinite period. As the constrained situation continues, different wells will be selected and subject
wells willbe returned to production in order to cycle the shut-ins around the field and allow well pressures to build up and assist
with future production.
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NAME(PLEASEP EILA PC O
,

TITLE REGULATORY ANALYST

SIGNATU DATE 11/3/2006

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reveme

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL& GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHlP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASlNG FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: SHUT IN
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The operator requests authorization to shut-in the subject well location. Gross production from the greater Natural Buttes area
is currently constrained at roughly 215mmcfd due to lack of export pipeline capacity. The field is capable of producing more
gas than this,which results in frequent and widespread bottlenecked areas of high line pressure. This in turn causes numerous
wells to log off of production, often requiring swab rigs to get them going again. Operating the field in this reactionary manner
is very inefficient. The operator requests authorization to shut in wells strategically to alleviate this situation and utilize the
resource more efficiently. A significant drop in production is not expected, as the field is constrained anyway. The subject well
was selected on the basis of one or more of the following factors:
*Located in a bottlenecked area; *High intervention requirement relative to gas production, *High water production
Wells will be shut in for an indefinite period. As the constrained situation continues, different wells will be selected and subject
wells willbe returned to production in order to cycle the shut-ins around the field and allow well pressures to build up and assist
with future production.
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(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reveme



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

T UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL Q GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL &GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL UT z,784078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSlTE OTHER: SHUT IN
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The operator requests authorization to shut-in the subject well location. Gross production from the greater Natural Buttes area
is currently constrained at roughly 215mmcfd due to lack of export pipeline capacity. The field is capable of producing more
gas than this, which results in frequent and widespread bottlenecked areas of high line pressure. This in turn causes numerous
wells to log off of production, often requiring swab rigs to get them going again. Operating the field in this reactionary manner
is very inefficient. The operator requests authorization to shut in wells strategically to alleviate this situation and utilize the
resource more efficiently. A significant drop in production is not expected, as the field is constrained anyway. The subject well
was selected on the basis of one or more of the followingfactors:
*Located in a bottlenecked area; *High intervention requirement relative to gas production, *High water production
Wells will be shut in for an indefinite period. As the constrained situation continues, different wells will be selected and subject
wells will be returned to production in order to cycle the shut-ins around the field and allow well pressures to build up and assist
with future production.

THE SUBJECT WELL LOCATION WAS RETURNED BACK TO PRODUCTION ON 11/21/2006 AT 5:00 PM.

NAMF(PlFASFPPINT) SHEILA UPCHEGO TITLE SENIOR LAND ADMIN SPECIALIST

SIGNATURE DATE 11/28/2006

(This space for State use only)
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(5/2000) (See instructions on Si )
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STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

T UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL Q GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL &GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL UT z,784078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSlTE OTHER: SHUT IN
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The operator requests authorization to shut-in the subject well location. Gross production from the greater Natural Buttes area
is currently constrained at roughly 215mmcfd due to lack of export pipeline capacity. The field is capable of producing more
gas than this, which results in frequent and widespread bottlenecked areas of high line pressure. This in turn causes numerous
wells to log off of production, often requiring swab rigs to get them going again. Operating the field in this reactionary manner
is very inefficient. The operator requests authorization to shut in wells strategically to alleviate this situation and utilize the
resource more efficiently. A significant drop in production is not expected, as the field is constrained anyway. The subject well
was selected on the basis of one or more of the followingfactors:
*Located in a bottlenecked area; *High intervention requirement relative to gas production, *High water production
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with future production.

THE SUBJECT WELL LOCATION WAS RETURNED BACK TO PRODUCTION ON 11/21/2006 AT 5:00 PM.

NAMF(PlFASFPPINT) SHEILA UPCHEGO TITLE SENIOR LAND ADMIN SPECIALIST

SIGNATURE DATE 11/28/2006

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See instructions on Si )

DIV.0F0ll.,GAS&

STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

T UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL Q GAS WELL OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL &GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST VERNAL UT z,784078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSlTE OTHER: SHUT IN
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The operator requests authorization to shut-in the subject well location. Gross production from the greater Natural Buttes area
is currently constrained at roughly 215mmcfd due to lack of export pipeline capacity. The field is capable of producing more
gas than this, which results in frequent and widespread bottlenecked areas of high line pressure. This in turn causes numerous
wells to log off of production, often requiring swab rigs to get them going again. Operating the field in this reactionary manner
is very inefficient. The operator requests authorization to shut in wells strategically to alleviate this situation and utilize the
resource more efficiently. A significant drop in production is not expected, as the field is constrained anyway. The subject well
was selected on the basis of one or more of the followingfactors:
*Located in a bottlenecked area; *High intervention requirement relative to gas production, *High water production
Wells will be shut in for an indefinite period. As the constrained situation continues, different wells will be selected and subject
wells will be returned to production in order to cycle the shut-ins around the field and allow well pressures to build up and assist
with future production.

THE SUBJECT WELL LOCATION WAS RETURNED BACK TO PRODUCTION ON 11/21/2006 AT 5:00 PM.

NAMF(PlFASFPPINT) SHEILA UPCHEGO TITLE SENIOR LAND ADMIN SPECIALIST

SIGNATURE DATE 11/28/2006

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See instructions on Si )

DIV.0F0ll.,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDES1GNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A
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7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPL1CATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.
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THE OPERATOR REQUESTS AUTHORIZATION TO RECOMPLETE THE SUBJECT WELL LOCATION. THE OPERATOR
PROPOSES TO COMPLETE THE WASATCH FORMATION. THE OPERATOR REQUESTS AUTHORIZTION TO
COMMINGLETHE NEWLY EXISTINGWASATCH FORMATION ALONG WITH THE EXISTING MESAVERDE FORMATION.

PLEASE REFER TO THE ATTACHED RECOMPLETION PROCEDURE.

COPYSENTTOOPERATOR
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Name: LOVE 1121-16B
Location: NW NE Sec 16 T11S R21E
Uintah County, UT
Date: 08/27/2008

ELEVATIONS: 5540 GL 5564 KB

TOTAL DEPTH: 8700 PBTD: 8656
SURFACE CASING: 9 5/8", 36# J-55 ST&C @1932'
PRODUCTION CASING: 4 1/2", 11.6#, I-80 LT&C @8700'

Marker Joint 3835-3862'

TUBULAR PROPERTIES:
BURST COLLAPSE DRIFT DIA. CAPACITIES
(psi) (psi) (in.) (bbl/ft) (gal/ft)

2 3/8" 4.7# J-55 7,700 8,100 1.901" 0.00387 0.1624
tbg
4 ½" l1.6#I-80 7780 6350 3.875" 0.0155 0.6528
(See above)
2 3/8" by 4 ½" 0.0101 0.4227
Annulus

TOPS:
795' Green River
1254' Mahogany
3854' Wasatch
6530' Mesaverde

Estimated T.O.C. from CBL @3000

GENERAL:

• A minimum of 4 tanks (cleaned lined 500 bbl) of recycled water will be required. Note: Use
biocide in tanks and the water needs to be at least 45°F at pump time.

• All perforation depths are from Halliburtons Induction-Density-Neutron log dated
08/02/2006

• 2 fracturing stages required for coverage.
• Procedure calls for 3 CBP's (8000 psi).
• Calculate open perforations after each breakdown. If less than 60% of the perforations

appear to be open, ball out with 15% HCl.
• Put scale inhibitor 3 gals/1000 gals (in pad and ½ the ramp) and 10 gals/1000 gals in all

flushes except the final stage. Remember to pre-load the casing with scale inhibitor for the
very first stage with 10 gpt.

• 30/50 mesh Ottawa sand, Slickwater frac.
• Maximum surface pressure 6200 psi.
• Flush volumes are the sum of slick water and acid used during displacement (include scale

inhibitor as mentioned above). DO NOT OVERDISPLACE. Stage acid and scale inhibitor
if necessary to cover the next perforated
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• Service companies need to provide surface/production annulus pop-offs to be set for 1500
psi for each frac.

• Pump 20/40mesh resin coated sand last 5,000# of all frac stages
• Tubing Currently Landed @~7441
• Originally completed on 8/18/2006

Existing Perforations:

Mesaverde 6534-6544' 4 spf
Mesaverde 6696-6706' 4 spf
Mesaverde 6925-6931' 4 spf
Mesaverde 7185-7189 4 spf
Mesaverde 7397-7405' 3 spf
Mesaverde 7579-7584' 4 spf
Mesaverde 7978-7981' 3 spf
Mesaverde 8085-8089' 3 spf
Mesaverde 8101-8107' 4 spf
Mesaverde 8204-8208' 4 spf
Mesaverde 8316-8323' 4 spf

PROCEDURE:

1. MIRU. Control well with recycled water and biocide as required. ND WH, NU BOP's and
test.

2. TOOH with 2-3/8", 4.7#, J-55 (or N-80) tubing (currently landed at ~7441'). Visually
inspect for scale and consider replacing if needed. .

3. If tbg looks ok consider running a gauge ring to 6344 (50' below proposed CBP). Otherwise
P/U a mill and C/O to 6344 (50' below proposed CBP).

4. Set 8000 psi CBP at ~ 6294'. Pressure test BOP and casing to 6000 psi. .

5. Perf the following with 3-3/8" gun, 23 gm, 0.36"hole:
Zone From To spf # of shots
WASATCH 6240 6244 4 16

RIH with downhole gauges on slickline and set gauges @6230' and perform a DFIT test.

R/U to perform a DFIT test.
All DFIT tests to include;
a. Pump 1000 gals @±5 bpm
b. Dump bail acid if need to b/d perfs
c. After pumping the above volume, shut well in and monitor for 6 hours minimum.
d. POOH w/ slickline and DH gauges.

6. Perf the remaining stage with 3-3/8" gun, 23 gm, 0.36"hole:
Zone From To spf # of shots
WASATCH 6226 6228 4
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RIH with downhole gauges on slickline and set gauges @6230' and perform a DFIT test.

R/U to perform a DFIT test.
All DFIT tests to include;
a. Pump 1000 gals @±5 bpm
b. Dump bail acid if need to b/d perfs
c. After pumping the above volume, shut well in and monitor for 6 hours minimum.
d. POOH w/ slickline and DH gauges.

6. Perf the remaining stage with 3-3/8" gun, 23 gm, 0.36"hole:
Zone From To spf # of shots
WASATCH 6226 6228 4



WASATCH 6234 6238 4 16

7. Breakdown perfs and establish injection rate (include scale inhibitor in fluid). Fracture as
outlined in Stage 1 on attached listing. Under-displace to ~6176' and
trickle 250gal 15%HCL w/ scale inhibitor in flush . RATE IS 40 BPM

8. Set 8000 psi CBP at ~5746'. Perf the following 3-3/8" gun, 23 gm, 0.36"hole:
Zone From To spf # of shots
WASATCH 5592 5596 4 16
WASATCH 5710 5716 4 24

9. Breakdown perfs and establish injection rate. Fracture as outlined in Stage 2 on attached
listing. Under-displace to ~5542' and flush only with recycled water.

10. Set 8000 psi CBP at ~5542'.

11. TIH with 3 7/8" bit, sliding sleeve, SN and tubing.

12. Drill plugs and clean out to6294. Open sleeve and DO NOT PUMP OFF SUB and land
tubing at ±5562' unless indicated otherwise by the well's behavior. This well will
not be commingled at this time.

13. Flow well back until well is flowing on its own, swab if needed. Check with engineer.

14. Close sleeve and drill out CBP at 6294'. Land tubing at (check with engineer, this will
depend on rate from Wasatch). Open sleeve.

15. RDMO

For design questions, please call
Curtis Caile, Denver, CO
(406)-490-2742 (Cell)
(720)-929-6194 (Office)

For field implementation questions, please call
Robert Miller, Vernal, UT
4350781 7041 (Office)
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FratturingSchedules
LOVE1121-16BRecompete
SlickwaterFrac

Scale
Feet Perfs Rate Fluid InitalFinalFluidVolumeCumVolVolumeCumVolFluidsandSandCmSandFootagefreminhib.,

¾ef
ZoneofPayTop,ftBot.,RSPFHolesBPM Type ppgppg gals gals BBLsBBLsfracSuffraeIbs Ibs CBPtaElushgal.

1WASAICH1 622662284 8VariedPumpintest Slickwater 0 0 0
WASATCH2 623462384 16 DISIPand6minlSIP 37
WASATCH3 624062444 16 40SlickwaterPad Slickwater3,1763,176 76 7615.0%0.0% 0 0 10
WASATCH0 40SlickwalerRamp0.25 illickater 6,0009,176143 21828.3%il.2% 3,750 3,Ï50 9
WASATCH0 40Skey 0 0Suwater 0 9,176 0 218 0.0% 0 3,750 0
WASATCH0 40SlickaterRamp1 1.6Slickwater600016,176143 36128.3%3(6% 7,49911,249 9
WASATCH0 40Ekg 0 0Slickwater 0 16,1760 361 0.0% 0 11,249 0
WASATCHl 40SlickwaterRamp 1.6 2S]ickwater6,00021,176143 60428.3%48.3%10,49921,748 0
WASATCH0 40Flush(4-12') 4,03225,20796 600 21,748 37
WASATCH0 SDPand6miniSDP 25,207 102
WASATCH0
WASATCH0
WASAICH0 andladenYelume. 21,175

gallft3,860 3,964ksadl
6 #efPeibstage48 FUshdep6176 GBPdep6,746 430

16.0« Abepumplime(min)
2WASATCH3 669266964 16MedPumpintest SlicWater 0 0 0
WASATCH6 671067164 24 0ISIPand6minISIP
WASATCH0 50SilekwaterPad Blickwater3,2063,206 76 7615.0%0.0% 0 0 10
WASATCH0 50SlicWaterRamp0.26 15|lekwater6,0669,263144 22128.3%11.2%3,786 3,786 9
WASATCH0 50SWkeep 0 0Slickwater 0 9263 0 221 0.0% 0 3,785 0
WASATCH0 50,SlichaterRamp1 SSlickwater6.06616319144 36628.3%3tS% 7,57011,366 9
WASATCH0 50Ekea 0 0Slickwater 0 16319 0 365 0.0% 0 11,366 0
WASATCH0 50SlickwaterRamp1.5 2SlicWater6,06621,375144 50928.3%48.3%10,59821,954 0
WASAICH0 60Flush(‡12) 3,61824,99386 695 21,964 0
WASATCH0 ISDPand6minISDP 24,993 28
WASATCH0
WASATCH0
WASATCH0 SandladenYalme 21376

LOOK gallft2,860 2,927ksadt
I #efPeds/stage40 Flüshdepth6642 GBPdepth6,642 i LOOK

119« Abepumptime(min)
Totals 13 80 TotalFMd49,971gals 1,190as TotalSand 43,702

1,190bb\s
0.4 2.6tank ieelScaleInhib.=
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LOVE1121-10Recenipete
PelÍelation801|@Stininialy

Pederations
Stage lenes lep,ft Betteni,ftSPF Heles FlactureCoverage

iWABATCH6226 6228 4 8 6227to 6228
WASATCH6234 6238 4 16 6236.6to 6231
WABATCH6240 6244 4 16 6240.6to 62416
#0fPeds/stage 40 GBPDEPTH6,146

2WASATCH6692 5596 4 16 5593.5to 5696
WASATCH6110 5116 4 24 6110.6to 6116.6
#efPefs/stage 40 CBPDEPTH6,642

Totals
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O
STATEOFUTAH FORM9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML-22347-A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnew wells,significantly deepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for suchproposals.

1. TYPEOF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1368 SOUTH 1200 EAST an VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-7024 UNDESIGNATED

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 648' I=NL,1630' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNE 16 11S 21E STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISS10N TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date ofwork completion:
COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: PRODUCTION
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

START-UP

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THE OPERATOR PERFORMED A RECOMPLETION ON THE SUBJECT WELL LOCATION.THE OPERATOR HAS PLACED

THE SUBJECT WELL LOCATIONBACKON PRODUCTION ON 11/7/2008 AT 0915 HRS.

PLEASE REFER TO THE ATTACHED CHRONOLOGICALWELLHISTORY.

NAME(PLEASEPRIN
SHEILAUPCHEGO TITLE REGULATORYANALYST

StGNATURE DATE 11/17/2008

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
NOV2 4 2008

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) DIV.OFOIL,GAS&
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Wins No.: 77351 LOVE 1121-16B API No.: 4304736254

EVENT INFORMATION: EVENT ACTIVITY: RECOMPLETION START DATE: 10/23/2008 AFE NO.: 2024526

OBJECTIVE: DEVELOPMENT END DATE: 10/29/2008

OBJECTIVE 2: RECOMPLETE DATEWELL STARTED PROD.: 7/15/2006

REASON: WAS Event End Status: COMPLETE

RIG OPERATIONS: Begin Mobilization Rig On Location Rig Charges Rig Operation Start Finish Drilling Rig Release Rig Off Location

MILES 3 / 3 10/23/2008 10/30/2008

10/23/2008 SUPERVISOR: DOUG CHIVERS

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P HSM. RIGGING UP & DOWN

7:30 - 17:00 9.50 COMP 31 I P SICP 200 PSI SITP 200 PSI. BLOW WELL DOWN. PUMP 20 BBLS
DOWN TUBING. ND WH NU BOP.
PUMP 40 BBLS DOWN CASING. PU ON TUBING LD HANGER.
POOH W/ 101 STANDS & LD 33 JTS ON TRAILER.
HEAVYSCALE @6,485'. SWI SDFN

10/24/2008 SUPERVISOR: DOUG ŠlVERS

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P HSM. PINCH POINTS

7:30 - 15:00 7.50 COMP 31 I P SICP 50 PSI. PUMP 30 BBLS OF 2% KCL TO KILLWELL.
PU 3 7/8" MILL& SUB & RIH WI 202 JTS OF 2 3/8" J-554.7# TBG.
TO MAKESURE CASING IS CLEAN FOR CBP TO BE SET @
6,294'. WE DID NOT TAG ANYTHING.
POOH W/ 2 3/8" TBG LD 28 JTS & SB 87 STANDS = 5,506' IN
DERRICK.
ND BOP NU FRAC VALVES. PREP FOR DIFITON MONDAY. SWI
SDFWE.

/27/2008 SUPERVISOR: GARTH McCONKlE

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P DAY1 - JSA & SM#1

7:30 - 8:30 1.00 COMP 34 i P SICP = 75 PSI. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. PU BAKER SK CBP.
RIH SET CBP @6294'. POOH l.JDTOOLS.

8:30 - 9:25 0.92 COMP 33 C P MIRU B & C QUICK TEST. P/T CSG & FRAC VALVES TO 6000 PSI.
(GOOD TEST) RDMO B & C QUICK TEST.

9:25 - 10:00 0.58 COMP 37 B P RIH Wl3 3/8" EXP GNS, 23 GRM, 0.36 HOLES, 90 DEG PHSG.,
PERF WASATCH @6240'- 44'. 4 SPF, 16 HOLES. POOH
WlWIRELINE.

10:00 - 10:20 0.33 COMP 35 E P MIRU DELSCO SLICKLINE PU HALCO DWN HOLE PRESSURE

GUAGES. RIH ON SLICKLINETO 6230'.

10:20 - 12:38 2.30 COMP 33 G P MIRU BJ ACID PMPR. PT SURFACE EQUIP. BRK DWN PERFS
2.1 BPM @3490 PSI. 1SIP = 1385. FG = 0.00. PMP 24 BBLS 2%
KCL WTR 4.6 BPM @2125 PSI. SD. ISIP = 1914 PSI.

12:38 - 13:00 0.37 COMP 13:00 RDMO BJ SERVICE. SWI - SDFD. PREP WELL TO POOH
WIPSI GUAGES A FRV IM AM.

1 8/ 008 SU EÑlSOR: G cCOÑl
6:45 - 7:00 0.25 COMP 48 P DAY4 - JSA & SM #4

7:00 - 7:20 0.33 COMP 33 E P WHP = 50 PSI. POOH W/HALCO DWN HOLE PRESSURE
GUAGES ON SLICKLINE. RDMO DELSCO SLICKLINE& HALCO.

7:20 - 9:35 2.25 COMP 37 B P STG 1) RIH W/3 3/8" EXP GNS, 23 GRM, 0.36 HOLES, 90 DEG
PHSG., PERF WASATCH @6234'- 38'. 4 SPF, 6226'-28', 4
SPF, 24 HOLES. (40 HOLES TOTAL IN STG). POOH
WlWIRELINE.

9:35 - 10:16 0.68 COMP 36 E P MIRU BJ SERVICES. HOLD BJ JSA & SM.
STG 1) PT SURFACE EQUIP. TO 7000 PSI. BRK DWN PERFS 5.3
BPM @2298 PSI. IS1P = 2298. FG = 0.73. PMP 250 GAL 15%

HCL. PMP 100 BBLS W/10/1000 SCALE INHIB. PMPD 80 BBLS
40.5 BPM @4000 PSI. 16/40 PERFS OPEN - 40%

MP 5228 PSI, MR 45 BPM, AP 3973 PS1, AR 40.4 BPM, ISIP =

2971 PSI. FG = 0.92. NPI = 1231 PSI. PMPD 1251 BBLS SLICK
WTR., 41,442 LBS OTTOWA SND, 2,361 LBS TLC SND, 43,803

LBS TOTAL SND.
10:16 - 11:30 1.23 COMP 37 B P STG 2) RIH Wl3 3/8" EXP GNS, 23 GRM, 0.36 HOLES, 90 DEG

PHSG., SET BAKER 8K CBP @5746', PERF WASATCH @5710' -

16'. 4 SPF, 5592'-96', 4 SPF, 40 HOLES.

11:30 - 12:40 1.17 COMP 36 E P STG 2) BRK DWN PERFS 4.5 BPM @ 2141 PSI. ISIP = 1963. FG
= 0.79. PMPD 90 BBLS 53.2 BPM @4300 PSI. 28/40 PERFS
OPEN-70%
MP 4619 PSI, MR 53.9 BPM, AP 3974 PSI, AR 53.5 BPM, ISIP =

2580 PSI. FG = 0.90. NPI = 617 PSI. PMPD 1370 BBLS SLICK
WTR., 47,783 LBS OTTOWA SND, 4,272 LBS TLC SND, 52,057
LBS TOTAL SND.

11/17/2008 1:06:05PM

Wins No.: 77351 LOVE 1121-16B API No.: 4304736254

EVENT INFORMATION: EVENT ACTIVITY: RECOMPLETION START DATE: 10/23/2008 AFE NO.: 2024526

OBJECTIVE: DEVELOPMENT END DATE: 10/29/2008

OBJECTIVE 2: RECOMPLETE DATEWELL STARTED PROD.: 7/15/2006

REASON: WAS Event End Status: COMPLETE

RIG OPERATIONS: Begin Mobilization Rig On Location Rig Charges Rig Operation Start Finish Drilling Rig Release Rig Off Location

MILES 3 / 3 10/23/2008 10/30/2008

10/23/2008 SUPERVISOR: DOUG CHIVERS

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P HSM. RIGGING UP & DOWN

7:30 - 17:00 9.50 COMP 31 I P SICP 200 PSI SITP 200 PSI. BLOW WELL DOWN. PUMP 20 BBLS
DOWN TUBING. ND WH NU BOP.
PUMP 40 BBLS DOWN CASING. PU ON TUBING LD HANGER.
POOH W/ 101 STANDS & LD 33 JTS ON TRAILER.
HEAVYSCALE @6,485'. SWI SDFN

10/24/2008 SUPERVISOR: DOUG ŠlVERS

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P HSM. PINCH POINTS

7:30 - 15:00 7.50 COMP 31 I P SICP 50 PSI. PUMP 30 BBLS OF 2% KCL TO KILLWELL.
PU 3 7/8" MILL& SUB & RIH WI 202 JTS OF 2 3/8" J-554.7# TBG.
TO MAKESURE CASING IS CLEAN FOR CBP TO BE SET @
6,294'. WE DID NOT TAG ANYTHING.
POOH W/ 2 3/8" TBG LD 28 JTS & SB 87 STANDS = 5,506' IN
DERRICK.
ND BOP NU FRAC VALVES. PREP FOR DIFITON MONDAY. SWI
SDFWE.

/27/2008 SUPERVISOR: GARTH McCONKlE

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P DAY1 - JSA & SM#1

7:30 - 8:30 1.00 COMP 34 i P SICP = 75 PSI. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. PU BAKER SK CBP.
RIH SET CBP @6294'. POOH l.JDTOOLS.

8:30 - 9:25 0.92 COMP 33 C P MIRU B & C QUICK TEST. P/T CSG & FRAC VALVES TO 6000 PSI.
(GOOD TEST) RDMO B & C QUICK TEST.

9:25 - 10:00 0.58 COMP 37 B P RIH Wl3 3/8" EXP GNS, 23 GRM, 0.36 HOLES, 90 DEG PHSG.,
PERF WASATCH @6240'- 44'. 4 SPF, 16 HOLES. POOH
WlWIRELINE.

10:00 - 10:20 0.33 COMP 35 E P MIRU DELSCO SLICKLINE PU HALCO DWN HOLE PRESSURE

GUAGES. RIH ON SLICKLINETO 6230'.

10:20 - 12:38 2.30 COMP 33 G P MIRU BJ ACID PMPR. PT SURFACE EQUIP. BRK DWN PERFS
2.1 BPM @3490 PSI. 1SIP = 1385. FG = 0.00. PMP 24 BBLS 2%
KCL WTR 4.6 BPM @2125 PSI. SD. ISIP = 1914 PSI.

12:38 - 13:00 0.37 COMP 13:00 RDMO BJ SERVICE. SWI - SDFD. PREP WELL TO POOH
WIPSI GUAGES A FRV IM AM.

1 8/ 008 SU EÑlSOR: G cCOÑl
6:45 - 7:00 0.25 COMP 48 P DAY4 - JSA & SM #4

7:00 - 7:20 0.33 COMP 33 E P WHP = 50 PSI. POOH W/HALCO DWN HOLE PRESSURE
GUAGES ON SLICKLINE. RDMO DELSCO SLICKLINE& HALCO.

7:20 - 9:35 2.25 COMP 37 B P STG 1) RIH W/3 3/8" EXP GNS, 23 GRM, 0.36 HOLES, 90 DEG
PHSG., PERF WASATCH @6234'- 38'. 4 SPF, 6226'-28', 4
SPF, 24 HOLES. (40 HOLES TOTAL IN STG). POOH
WlWIRELINE.

9:35 - 10:16 0.68 COMP 36 E P MIRU BJ SERVICES. HOLD BJ JSA & SM.
STG 1) PT SURFACE EQUIP. TO 7000 PSI. BRK DWN PERFS 5.3
BPM @2298 PSI. IS1P = 2298. FG = 0.73. PMP 250 GAL 15%

HCL. PMP 100 BBLS W/10/1000 SCALE INHIB. PMPD 80 BBLS
40.5 BPM @4000 PSI. 16/40 PERFS OPEN - 40%

MP 5228 PSI, MR 45 BPM, AP 3973 PS1, AR 40.4 BPM, ISIP =

2971 PSI. FG = 0.92. NPI = 1231 PSI. PMPD 1251 BBLS SLICK
WTR., 41,442 LBS OTTOWA SND, 2,361 LBS TLC SND, 43,803

LBS TOTAL SND.
10:16 - 11:30 1.23 COMP 37 B P STG 2) RIH Wl3 3/8" EXP GNS, 23 GRM, 0.36 HOLES, 90 DEG

PHSG., SET BAKER 8K CBP @5746', PERF WASATCH @5710' -

16'. 4 SPF, 5592'-96', 4 SPF, 40 HOLES.

11:30 - 12:40 1.17 COMP 36 E P STG 2) BRK DWN PERFS 4.5 BPM @ 2141 PSI. ISIP = 1963. FG
= 0.79. PMPD 90 BBLS 53.2 BPM @4300 PSI. 28/40 PERFS
OPEN-70%
MP 4619 PSI, MR 53.9 BPM, AP 3974 PSI, AR 53.5 BPM, ISIP =

2580 PSI. FG = 0.90. NPI = 617 PSI. PMPD 1370 BBLS SLICK
WTR., 47,783 LBS OTTOWA SND, 4,272 LBS TLC SND, 52,057
LBS TOTAL SND.

11/17/2008 1:06:05PM

Wins No.: 77351 LOVE 1121-16B API No.: 4304736254

EVENT INFORMATION: EVENT ACTIVITY: RECOMPLETION START DATE: 10/23/2008 AFE NO.: 2024526

OBJECTIVE: DEVELOPMENT END DATE: 10/29/2008

OBJECTIVE 2: RECOMPLETE DATEWELL STARTED PROD.: 7/15/2006

REASON: WAS Event End Status: COMPLETE

RIG OPERATIONS: Begin Mobilization Rig On Location Rig Charges Rig Operation Start Finish Drilling Rig Release Rig Off Location

MILES 3 / 3 10/23/2008 10/30/2008

10/23/2008 SUPERVISOR: DOUG CHIVERS

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P HSM. RIGGING UP & DOWN

7:30 - 17:00 9.50 COMP 31 I P SICP 200 PSI SITP 200 PSI. BLOW WELL DOWN. PUMP 20 BBLS
DOWN TUBING. ND WH NU BOP.
PUMP 40 BBLS DOWN CASING. PU ON TUBING LD HANGER.
POOH W/ 101 STANDS & LD 33 JTS ON TRAILER.
HEAVYSCALE @6,485'. SWI SDFN

10/24/2008 SUPERVISOR: DOUG ŠlVERS

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P HSM. PINCH POINTS

7:30 - 15:00 7.50 COMP 31 I P SICP 50 PSI. PUMP 30 BBLS OF 2% KCL TO KILLWELL.
PU 3 7/8" MILL& SUB & RIH WI 202 JTS OF 2 3/8" J-554.7# TBG.
TO MAKESURE CASING IS CLEAN FOR CBP TO BE SET @
6,294'. WE DID NOT TAG ANYTHING.
POOH W/ 2 3/8" TBG LD 28 JTS & SB 87 STANDS = 5,506' IN
DERRICK.
ND BOP NU FRAC VALVES. PREP FOR DIFITON MONDAY. SWI
SDFWE.

/27/2008 SUPERVISOR: GARTH McCONKlE

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P DAY1 - JSA & SM#1

7:30 - 8:30 1.00 COMP 34 i P SICP = 75 PSI. MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE. PU BAKER SK CBP.
RIH SET CBP @6294'. POOH l.JDTOOLS.

8:30 - 9:25 0.92 COMP 33 C P MIRU B & C QUICK TEST. P/T CSG & FRAC VALVES TO 6000 PSI.
(GOOD TEST) RDMO B & C QUICK TEST.

9:25 - 10:00 0.58 COMP 37 B P RIH Wl3 3/8" EXP GNS, 23 GRM, 0.36 HOLES, 90 DEG PHSG.,
PERF WASATCH @6240'- 44'. 4 SPF, 16 HOLES. POOH
WlWIRELINE.

10:00 - 10:20 0.33 COMP 35 E P MIRU DELSCO SLICKLINE PU HALCO DWN HOLE PRESSURE

GUAGES. RIH ON SLICKLINETO 6230'.

10:20 - 12:38 2.30 COMP 33 G P MIRU BJ ACID PMPR. PT SURFACE EQUIP. BRK DWN PERFS
2.1 BPM @3490 PSI. 1SIP = 1385. FG = 0.00. PMP 24 BBLS 2%
KCL WTR 4.6 BPM @2125 PSI. SD. ISIP = 1914 PSI.

12:38 - 13:00 0.37 COMP 13:00 RDMO BJ SERVICE. SWI - SDFD. PREP WELL TO POOH
WIPSI GUAGES A FRV IM AM.

1 8/ 008 SU EÑlSOR: G cCOÑl
6:45 - 7:00 0.25 COMP 48 P DAY4 - JSA & SM #4

7:00 - 7:20 0.33 COMP 33 E P WHP = 50 PSI. POOH W/HALCO DWN HOLE PRESSURE
GUAGES ON SLICKLINE. RDMO DELSCO SLICKLINE& HALCO.

7:20 - 9:35 2.25 COMP 37 B P STG 1) RIH W/3 3/8" EXP GNS, 23 GRM, 0.36 HOLES, 90 DEG
PHSG., PERF WASATCH @6234'- 38'. 4 SPF, 6226'-28', 4
SPF, 24 HOLES. (40 HOLES TOTAL IN STG). POOH
WlWIRELINE.

9:35 - 10:16 0.68 COMP 36 E P MIRU BJ SERVICES. HOLD BJ JSA & SM.
STG 1) PT SURFACE EQUIP. TO 7000 PSI. BRK DWN PERFS 5.3
BPM @2298 PSI. IS1P = 2298. FG = 0.73. PMP 250 GAL 15%

HCL. PMP 100 BBLS W/10/1000 SCALE INHIB. PMPD 80 BBLS
40.5 BPM @4000 PSI. 16/40 PERFS OPEN - 40%

MP 5228 PSI, MR 45 BPM, AP 3973 PS1, AR 40.4 BPM, ISIP =

2971 PSI. FG = 0.92. NPI = 1231 PSI. PMPD 1251 BBLS SLICK
WTR., 41,442 LBS OTTOWA SND, 2,361 LBS TLC SND, 43,803

LBS TOTAL SND.
10:16 - 11:30 1.23 COMP 37 B P STG 2) RIH Wl3 3/8" EXP GNS, 23 GRM, 0.36 HOLES, 90 DEG

PHSG., SET BAKER 8K CBP @5746', PERF WASATCH @5710' -

16'. 4 SPF, 5592'-96', 4 SPF, 40 HOLES.

11:30 - 12:40 1.17 COMP 36 E P STG 2) BRK DWN PERFS 4.5 BPM @ 2141 PSI. ISIP = 1963. FG
= 0.79. PMPD 90 BBLS 53.2 BPM @4300 PSI. 28/40 PERFS
OPEN-70%
MP 4619 PSI, MR 53.9 BPM, AP 3974 PSI, AR 53.5 BPM, ISIP =

2580 PSI. FG = 0.90. NPI = 617 PSI. PMPD 1370 BBLS SLICK
WTR., 47,783 LBS OTTOWA SND, 4,272 LBS TLC SND, 52,057
LBS TOTAL SND.

11/17/2008 1:06:05PM



Wins No.: 77351 LOVE 1121-16B API No.: 4304736254

12:40 - 13:50 1.17 COMP 37 P KILLPLUG) RIH SET BAKER 8K CBP @5542'. POOH
WlWIRELINE TOOLS & L/D. RDMO CUTTERS & BJ SERVICES.

13:50 - 13:50 0.00 COMP 31 1 P ND FRACVALVES, NUBOP. RU FLOOR &TBG EQUIP. P/U 3 7/8"
BIT, SLIDING SLEEVE ASSEMBLY, RIH ON USED 2 3/8" 4.7#

JS5 TBG. EOT @5506'. SWI - SDFN. PREP WELL TO DRLG
PLGS IN AM

10/29/2008 SUPERVISOR: GARTH McCONKIE

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P DAY5 - JSA & SM #5

7:30 - 11:30 4.00 COMP 44 C P WHP = 0 PSI. EOT @ 5506'
RU PWR SWVL, EST CIRC. Wl2% KCL WTR., PT BOP TO 3000
PSI. RIH TAG FILL @5522'. C/O 20' OF SND. FCP = 0 PSI

CBP #1) DRLG OUT BAKER SK CBP @5542' IN 10 MIN. 400 PSI
DIFF. RIH TAG FILL @5737. C/O 15' OF SND. FCP = 50 PSI.

CBP #2) DRLG OUT BAKER 8K CBP @5746' fN 10 MIN. 200 PSI
DIFF. RIH TAG FILL@6284'. C/O 10' OF SND. FCP = 100 PSI.
PBTD @6294'. CIRC WELL CLEAN W/2% KCL WTR.

R/D PWR SWVL. POOH L/D 7 JTS ON FLOAT. (L/D40 TOTAL
FROM STRING). LANDTBG ON HANGER Wl195 JTS USED 2 3/8

4.7# JSS TBG. EOT @6148.26'. SLEEVE NIPPLE @6176.37.
R/D FLOOR &TBG EQUIP. NDBOP, NUWH.

11:30 - 13:00 1.50 COMP 35 F P MIRU DELSCO SLICKLINE. RIH & RETRIEVE SLIDING SLEEVE.
POOH. PU NOTCHED SLIDING SLEEVE & RIH TO 6176' & SET IN
SLEEVE HOUSING. POOH. RDMO DELSCO SLICKLINE.
13:00 TURN WELL TO F.B.C. - SICP = 550 PSI. SITP = 700 PSI.
SDFD.

10/30/2008 SUPERVISOR: GARTH McCONKIE

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P DAY6 - JSA & SM #6

7:30 - 9:00 1.50 COMP 30 C P RDMO SERVICE UNIT.

9:00 - 9:00 0.00 COMP 30 A P MIRU SERVICE UNIT. SPOT EQUIP.
11:00 SDFD.

10/30/2008 SUPERVISOR: JOHN KYNASTON

7:00 - 33 A 7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 50#, TP 75#, 48/64" CK, 22 BWPH,
TRACE SAND, LIGHT GAS
TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 1087
BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER: 1643

10/31/2008 SUPFRVISOR: OHN KYNASTON

7:00 - 33 A 7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 10#, TP 30#, OPEN/64" CK, 4 BWPM

NONE SAND, LIGHTGAS
TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 1189
BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER: 1541

11/5/2008 SUPE S I

7:00 - 33 A 7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 700#, TP 225#, 26/64" CK, 8 BWPH,
TRACE SAND, LIGHT GAS
TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 2071
BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER: 659

1 /6/20 RVI R H KYN O

7:00 - 33 A 7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 550#, TP 150#, 26/64" CK, 7 BWPH,
TRACE SAND, LIGHT GAS
TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 2258
BBLS LEFT TO RFCOVER: 472

11/7/2008 SÖÑRVI HN N O
7:00 - 33 A 7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 500, TP 150#, 30/64" CK, 3 BWPH,

CLEAN SAND, LIGHT GAS
TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 2408
BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER: 322

9:15 - PROD
WELL TURNED TO SALES @ 0915 HR ON 11/7/08 - FTP 150#, CP
550#, CK 30/64", 300 MCFD, 96 BWPD

14
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Wins No.: 77351 LOVE 1121-16B API No.: 4304736254

12:40 - 13:50 1.17 COMP 37 P KILLPLUG) RIH SET BAKER 8K CBP @5542'. POOH
WlWIRELINE TOOLS & L/D. RDMO CUTTERS & BJ SERVICES.

13:50 - 13:50 0.00 COMP 31 1 P ND FRACVALVES, NUBOP. RU FLOOR &TBG EQUIP. P/U 3 7/8"

BIT, SLIDING SLEEVE ASSEMBLY, RIH ON USED 2 3/8" 4.7#

JS5 TBG. EOT @5506'. SWI - SDFN. PREP WELL TO DRLG
PLGS IN AM

10/29/2008 SUPERVISOR: GARTH McCONKIE

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P DAY5 - JSA & SM #5

7:30 - 11:30 4.00 COMP 44 C P WHP = 0 PSI. EOT @ 5506'
RU PWR SWVL, EST CIRC. Wl2% KCL WTR., PT BOP TO 3000
PSI. RIH TAG FILL @5522'. C/O 20' OF SND. FCP = 0 PSI

CBP #1) DRLG OUT BAKER SK CBP @5542' IN 10 MIN. 400 PSI
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FROM STRING). LANDTBG ON HANGER Wl195 JTS USED 2 3/8

4.7# JSS TBG. EOT @6148.26'. SLEEVE NIPPLE @6176.37.
R/D FLOOR &TBG EQUIP. NDBOP, NUWH.

11:30 - 13:00 1.50 COMP 35 F P MIRU DELSCO SLICKLINE. RIH & RETRIEVE SLIDING SLEEVE.
POOH. PU NOTCHED SLIDING SLEEVE & RIH TO 6176' & SET IN
SLEEVE HOUSING. POOH. RDMO DELSCO SLICKLINE.
13:00 TURN WELL TO F.B.C. - SICP = 550 PSI. SITP = 700 PSI.
SDFD.

10/30/2008 SUPERVISOR: GARTH McCONKIE

7:00 - 7:30 0.50 COMP 48 P DAY6 - JSA & SM #6

7:30 - 9:00 1.50 COMP 30 C P RDMO SERVICE UNIT.

9:00 - 9:00 0.00 COMP 30 A P MIRU SERVICE UNIT. SPOT EQUIP.
11:00 SDFD.

10/30/2008 SUPERVISOR: JOHN KYNASTON

7:00 - 33 A 7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 50#, TP 75#, 48/64" CK, 22 BWPH,
TRACE SAND, LIGHT GAS
TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 1087
BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER: 1643

10/31/2008 SUPFRVISOR: OHN KYNASTON

7:00 - 33 A 7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 10#, TP 30#, OPEN/64" CK, 4 BWPM

NONE SAND, LIGHTGAS
TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 1189
BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER: 1541

11/5/2008 SUPE S I

7:00 - 33 A 7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 700#, TP 225#, 26/64" CK, 8 BWPH,
TRACE SAND, LIGHT GAS
TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 2071
BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER: 659

1 /6/20 RVI R H KYN O

7:00 - 33 A 7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 550#, TP 150#, 26/64" CK, 7 BWPH,
TRACE SAND, LIGHT GAS
TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 2258
BBLS LEFT TO RFCOVER: 472

11/7/2008 SÖÑRVI HN N O

7:00 - 33 A 7 AM FLBK REPORT: CP 500, TP 150#, 30/64" CK, 3 BWPH,
CLEAN SAND, LIGHT GAS
TTL BBLS RECOVERED: 2408
BBLS LEFT TO RECOVER: 322

9:15 - PROD
WELL TURNED TO SALES @ 0915 HR ON 11/7/08 - FTP 150#, CP
550#, CK 30/64", 300 MCFD, 96 BWPD
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Wins No.: 77351 LOVE 1121-16B API No.: 4304736254

EVENT INFORMATION: EVENT ACTIVITY: WORKOVER / REP/ START DATE: 11/17/2008 AFE NO.: 2024526

OBJECTIVE: SECONDARY END DATE:

OBJECTIVE 2: CLEANOUT DATEWELL STARTED PROD.: 7/15/2006

REASON: D/O CBP, C/O Event End Status:

RIG OPERATIONS: Begin Mobilization Rig On Location Rig Charges Rig Operation Start Finish Drilling Rig Release Rig Off Location

KEY 59 / 59

Date Time Duration Phase Code iSubco P/U Operation
Start-End (hr) de

SUPERVISOR: JOHN KYNASTON l

11/17/2008 1:06:05PM
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STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes}

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6 IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

ta TYPË OF WELL
ELL

WESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

b TYPE OF WORK: 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
wEEWL HOR DNEEP-

TRY
SFŸR

OTHER RECOMPLETION LOVE 1121-16B
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9 APINUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1368 S1200 E cav VERNAL SiATE UT e84078 (435)781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11 QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
ATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL NWNE 16 11S 21E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW:

12 COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTALDEPTH: UINTAH UTAH

14 DATE SPUDDED: 15 DATE T D. REACHED. 16 DATE COMPLETED: 17 ELEVATIONS(DF. RKB,RT, GL):

6/29/2006 7/24/2006 11/7/0200 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE O 5544'GL
18 TOTAL DEFTH: MD 8,700 m "'" 6^cu r M3 6,294 20 IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS. HOW MANY?* 21 DEPTH BRIDGE MD

PLUG SET:
TVD TVD TVD

22 TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copyofeach) 23

N/A WAS WELL CORED7 NO YES (Submit analysis)
WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submit report)

DIRECTIONALSURVEY7 NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SL2EFGRADE WEIGHT (#M1) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGE C EKTER CEMENTSTA
5 VOLL BL)

CEMENT TOP * AMOUN1 PULLED

20" 14" STL 36.7# 40 28

12 1/4" 9 5/8 H-40 32.3# 1,940 660

7 7/8" 4 1/2 580 11.6# 8,700 1639

25. TUBING RECORD

Si21- DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MO) Bl2E DEP lH SEF (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2 3/8" 6,148
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MO) BOTTDM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) LNTERVAL(Top/Bul - MD) SLZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) WASATCH 6,148 6,244 6,148 6,244 0.36 80 open agueeza O
(B) Open Squeezed

(D) Open Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT,CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

6148'-6244 PMP 2621 BBLS SLICK H2O & 95,860# 30/50 OTTOWASD

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY PROD
SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER

5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

DIV.0F OIL,GAS&

STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes}

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
ML-22347-A

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6 IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

ta TYPË OF WELL
ELL

WESLL DRY OTHER 7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

b TYPE OF WORK: 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
wEEWL HOR DNEEP-

TRY
SFŸR

OTHER RECOMPLETION LOVE 1121-16B
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9 APINUMBER:

KERR McGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE LP 4304736254
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

1368 S1200 E cav VERNAL SiATE UT e84078 (435)781-7024 UNDESIGNATED
4 LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11 QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
ATSURFACE: 648'FNL, 1630'FEL NWNE 16 11S 21E
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW:

12 COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTALDEPTH: UINTAH UTAH

14 DATE SPUDDED: 15 DATE T D. REACHED. 16 DATE COMPLETED: 17 ELEVATIONS(DF. RKB,RT, GL):

6/29/2006 7/24/2006 11/7/0200 ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE O 5544'GL
18 TOTAL DEFTH: MD 8,700 m "'" 6^cu r M3 6,294 20 IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS. HOW MANY?* 21 DEPTH BRIDGE MD

PLUG SET:
TVD TVD TVD

22 TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copyofeach) 23

N/A WAS WELL CORED7 NO YES (Submit analysis)
WAS DST RUN? NO YES (Submit report)

DIRECTIONALSURVEY7 NO YES (Submit copy)
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5 VOLL BL)
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29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:
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5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

DIV.0F OIL,GAS&



31. INITIAL PRODUCTION INTERVAL A (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: 1NATER- BBL: PROD METHOD:

11/7/2008 11/12/2008 24 RATES: -' O 540 100 FLOWING
CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL. INTERVALSTATUS:

26/64 119 0 RATES: ¯' O 540 100 PROD
INTERVALB (As shown In Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION DIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES:

CHOKE SIZE TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL ·- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVALC (As shown in Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG PRESS CSG PRESS PI GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAslolL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION DIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS
RATES: -*

INTERVALD (As shown in Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL GAS - MCF: WATER -BBL: PROD METHOD
RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE. BG PRESS CSG. PRESS API GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -b

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

SOLD
33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION(Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contenisthereof:Cored intervals and alldrill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushionused, timetool open, flowingand shut-inpressures and recoveries

Formation Descriptions,Contents,etc Name (MeasuredpDepth)

WASATCH 3,833 6,243
MESAVERDE 6,534 8,323

35. ADDITIONALREMARKS (Include plugging procedure)

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached Information Is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) EILAUPCHEG TITLE REGULATORYANALYST

SIGNAIURE DATE 12/10/2008

This report must be submitted within 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well e reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM 20: Show the number of completionsif production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

** ITEM24: Cement Top-Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
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API Well No: 43047362540000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22347-A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 LOVE 1121-16B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 LOVE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0648 FNL 1630 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

4/30/2010

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 THIS WELL RETURNED TO PRODUCTION ON 4/30/2010.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Andy Lytle

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5/3/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
720 929-6007  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
720 929-6100

May 03, 2010

May 05, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047362540000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING "MLLEA2S2EDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6007 Ext LOVE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0648 FNL 1630 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

4/30/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THIS WELL RETURNED TO PRODUCTION ON 4/30/2010.
Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâgggNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/3/2010

RECEIVED May 03,

iPI Well No: 43047362540000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING "MLLEA2S2EDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6007 Ext LOVE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0648 FNL 1630 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

4/30/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THIS WELL RETURNED TO PRODUCTION ON 4/30/2010.
Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâgggNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/3/2010

RECEIVED May 03,

iPI Well No: 43047362540000

FORM 9

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING "MLLEA2S2EDESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6007 Ext LOVE

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0648 FNL 1630 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr; NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat
o

UWENrkRCEPmOpReTtion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

4/30/2010 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR rtOD
e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THIS WELL RETURNED TO PRODUCTION ON 4/30/2010.
Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECâgggNLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Andy Lytle 720 929-6100 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/3/2010

RECEIVED May 03,



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22347-A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 LOVE 1121-16B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6515  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 LOVE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0648 FNL 1630 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

8/2/2011

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 THE SUBJECT WELL WAS RETURNED TO PRODUCTION ON 08/02/2011.  

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Sheila Wopsock 435 781-7024

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 8/5/2011

08/18/2011

Aug. 05, 2011

Sundry Number: 17356 API Well Number: 43047362540000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING "QLLEA22EDESAIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6515 E×t LOVE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0648 FNL 1630 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/2/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THE SUBJECT WELL WAS RETURNED TO PRODUCTION ON 08/02/2011.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Sheila Wopsock 435 781-7024 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING "QLLEA22EDESAIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6515 E×t LOVE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0648 FNL 1630 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/2/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THE SUBJECT WELL WAS RETURNED TO PRODUCTION ON 08/02/2011.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Sheila Wopsock 435 781-7024 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING "QLLEA22EDESAIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6515 E×t LOVE

4.LOCATIONOFVVELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0648 FNL 1630 FEL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SDUat ofUWENrkRCEPmOp
tion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/2/2011 OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT
PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

Date of Spud:
REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLINR RErt
D e. WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR C( MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

THE SUBJECT WELL WAS RETURNED TO PRODUCTION ON 08/02/2011.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Sheila Wopsock 435 781-7024 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



RECEIVED: Oct. 01, 2015

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22347-A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 LOVE 1121-16B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6100  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 LOVE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0648 FNL 1630 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

10 /2 /2015

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP respectfully requests to
plug and abandon the Love 1121-16B well. Please see the

attached procedure for details. Thank you.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Kristina Geno 720 929-6824

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 10 /1 /2015

October 22, 2015

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22347-A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL& GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 1DDVIExt

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0648 FNL 1630 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/2/2015
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP respectfully requests to Approved by the
plug and abandon the Love 1121-16B well. Please see the utah Division of

attached procedure for details. Thank you. Oil, Gas and Mining

October 22, 2015

PleaseReviewAtladiedCuditiusofAppron\

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kristina Geno 720 929-6824 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/1/2015

RECEIVED: Oct. 01,

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22347-A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL& GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 1DDVIExt

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

0648 FNL 1630 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

10/2/2015
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP respectfully requests to Approved by the
plug and abandon the Love 1121-16B well. Please see the utah Division of

attached procedure for details. Thank you. Oil, Gas and Mining

October 22, 2015

PleaseReviewAtladiedCuditiusofAppron\

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Kristina Geno 720 929-6824 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 10/1/2015

RECEIVED: Oct. 01,



RECEIVED: Oct. 22, 2015

  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047362540000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 2. Add Plug #1A. Set CIBP @6650’. Spot plug (+/- 8 sx)
6550’-6650’. 3. Amend Plug #1. Spot plug (+/- 8 sx) 5430’-5530’ in accordance with

R649-3-24.3.2. 4. Move Plug #3 uphole to 3190’-2930’. Base of the moderately saline ground
water at 3000’. 5. Plug #4. Lite cement behind pipe at this depth according to the CBL so
spotting a plug (+/- 16 sx) from 2120’-1910’ would be sufficient. 6. Plug #5. CICR not

necessary. Cement appears to be in annulus. If circulation is established, cement can be
circulated from surface through perfs back to surface. The quantities proposed for this plug are
adequate to accomplish this. Plug # 6 would not be necessary if Plug #5 is pumped as proposed

with or without the CICR. 7. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the
depth specified. 8. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface. 9.
Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 – Well Site Restoration. 10. All
requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 11. If there

are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet at
801-538-5281 (office) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure. 12. All
other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules shall

apply. 

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
TI, BAS Pr NINTfdG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047362540000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 2. Add Plug #1A. Set CIBP @6650'. Spot plug (+/- 8 sx)
6550'-6650'. 3. Amend Plug #1. Spot plug (+/- 8 sx) 5430'-5530' in accordance with

R649-3-24.3.2. 4. Move Plug #3 uphole to 3190'-2930'. Base of the moderately saline ground
water at 3000'. 5. Plug #4. Lite cement behind pipe at this depth according to the CBL so

spotting a plug (+/- 16 sx) from 2120'-1910' would be sufficient. 6. Plug #5. CICR not
necessary. Cement appears to be in annulus. If circulation is established, cement can be

circulated from surface through perfs back to surface. The quantities proposed for this plug are
adequate to accomplish this. Plug # 6 would not be necessary if Plug #5 is pumped as proposed

with or without the CICR. 7. AII balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the
depth specified. 8. AII annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100' to the surface. 9.
Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 - Well Site Restoration. 10. AII
requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 11. If there

are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet at
801-538-5281 (office) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure. 12. AII
other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules shall

apply.

RECEIVED: Oct. 22,

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

UTAH

DNR The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices
TI, BAS Pr NINTfdG

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047362540000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 2. Add Plug #1A. Set CIBP @6650'. Spot plug (+/- 8 sx)
6550'-6650'. 3. Amend Plug #1. Spot plug (+/- 8 sx) 5430'-5530' in accordance with

R649-3-24.3.2. 4. Move Plug #3 uphole to 3190'-2930'. Base of the moderately saline ground
water at 3000'. 5. Plug #4. Lite cement behind pipe at this depth according to the CBL so

spotting a plug (+/- 16 sx) from 2120'-1910' would be sufficient. 6. Plug #5. CICR not
necessary. Cement appears to be in annulus. If circulation is established, cement can be

circulated from surface through perfs back to surface. The quantities proposed for this plug are
adequate to accomplish this. Plug # 6 would not be necessary if Plug #5 is pumped as proposed

with or without the CICR. 7. AII balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the
depth specified. 8. AII annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100' to the surface. 9.
Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 - Well Site Restoration. 10. AII
requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 11. If there

are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet at
801-538-5281 (office) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure. 12. AII
other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules shall

apply.

RECEIVED: Oct. 22,
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Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

ro/s/2ors Wellbore Diagram _ r263

API Well No: 43-047-36254-00-00 Permit No: Well Name/No: LOVE 1121-16B

Company Name: KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

Location: See: 16 T: 11S R: 21E Spot: NWNE String Information
Coordinates: X: 622405 Y: 4413866 Bottom Diameter Weight Length Cct ac a

String (ft sub) (inches) (Ib/ft) (ft)Field Name: LOVE
HOL1 40 20

County Name: UINTAH COND 40 14 36.7 40
HOL2 1940 12.25

SURF 1940 9.625 32.3 1940
L3 8700 7.875

Cement from 40 ñ. to surface C

Conductor: 14 in, @40 04 PROD 8700 4.5 11.6 8700

\ Mc r T / 744 I 2.375
Hote: 20 in. @40 ñ, g)

Cement from 1940 ILto surface

rface: 9.625 in. @1940 ft

Atc ole: 12.25 n. 1940

ement Information
BOC TOC

Strmg (ft sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks
PCROONDD 87000 0

©

UUKK 3869

SURF 1940 UK 660

ora n Information

(f ub) f
suob

Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze

50 rutation Information

UA WSTC 3842

Cement from 8700 ft.
MVRD 6631

Tubing: 2.375 in. @7441 ft

Production: 4.5 in. @8700 ft

Hole: 7.875 in. @8700 ft

TI: 8700 TVD: 8700 PBTD: 8656
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String (ft sub) (inches) (Ib/ft) (ft)Field Name: LOVE
HOL1 40 20

County Name: UINTAH COND 40 14 36.7 40
HOL2 1940 12.25

SURF 1940 9.625 32.3 1940
L3 8700 7.875

Cement from 40 ñ. to surface C

Conductor: 14 in, @40 04 PROD 8700 4.5 11.6 8700

\ Mc r T / 744 I 2.375
Hote: 20 in. @40 ñ, g)

Cement from 1940 ILto surface

rface: 9.625 in. @1940 ft

Atc ole: 12.25 n. 1940

ement Information
BOC TOC

Strmg (ft sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks
PCROONDD 87000 0

©

UUKK 3869

SURF 1940 UK 660

ora n Information

(f ub) f
suob

Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze

50 rutation Information

UA WSTC 3842

Cement from 8700 ft.
MVRD 6631

Tubing: 2.375 in. @7441 ft
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Hole: 7.875 in. @8700 ft

TI: 8700 TVD: 8700 PBTD: 8656

Page



RECEIVED: Oct. 01, 2015

LOVE 1121-16B 

648’ FNL & 1630’ FEL 

NW/NE SEC. 16, T11S, R21E 

Uintah County, UT 

 

KBE:  5564’    API NUMBER:  4304736254 

GLE:  5540’    LEASE NUMBER:  ML-22347-A 

TD:  8700’’    LAT/LONG:   39.86601/-109.56883 

      

CASING :  20” hole 

   14” 36.7# STL Conductor @ 40’ 

   Cmt w/ 28 sxs 

 

12 1/4” hole 

 9 5/8” 32.3# H-40 ST&C @ 1932’ 

 Cmt w/ 660sxs 

   

 

 7 7/8” hole 

 4.5” 11.6# I-80 LT&C @ 8700’ 

 Cmt w/ 1639 sxs 

   

  

 

PERFORATIONS:  Wasatch/Mesaverde 5,592’-8,323’ 

       

TUBING:   2 3/8” 4.7# J-55 tbg at 7214’ 

 

Gal./ft. Bbl./ft.

2.375” 4.7# J-55 tbg. 1.901 8100 7700 0.1624 0.00387

4.5” 11.6# I-80 3.875 6350 7780 0.6528 0.0155

9.625” 32.3# H-40 8.845 1400 2270 3.3055 0.0787

Annular Capacities

0.4227 0.0565

2.478 0.3314

1.704 0.2278

2.3428 0.3132

3.4852 0.4659

8.3232 1.112614” csg X 20” borehole 0.1982

2.375” tbg. X 4 ½” 11.6# csg 0.01

4.5” csg X 9 5/8” 32.3# csg 0.059

4.5” csg X 7.875 borehole 0.0406

0.0872

0.4418

Tubular/Borehole Capacities

Cuft/ft.

0.02171

Drift 

inches

Collapse psi Burst psi

9.625” csg X 12 1/4” borehole 0.0558

9 .625” csg X 14” csg 0.083

 
    

GEOLOGIC INFORMATION: 

 

Formation   Depth to top, ft.  

Green River   795’ 

Mahogany   1253’ 

GRN    2223’ 

Wasatch   3832’ 

DKCYN    6624’ 

 

http://geology.utah.gov/online/ss/ss-144/ss-144pl1.pdf 

USDW Elevation   ~2,200’ MSL 

USDW Depth   ~3,364’ KBL 

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

LOVE1121-16B
648' FNL & 1630' FEL
NW/NE SEC. 16, T11S, R21E
Uintah County, UT

KBE: 5564' API NUMBER: 4304736254

GLE: 5540' LEASE NUMBER: ML-22347-A
TD: 8700" LAT/LONG: 39.866o1/-109.56883

CASING : 20" hole
14" 36.7# STL Conductor @ 40'
Cmt w/ 28 sxs

12 1/4" hole
9 5/8" 32.3# H-40 ST&C @ 1932'
Cmt w/ 660sxs

7 7/8" hole
4.5" 11.6# I-80 LT&C@ 8700'
Cmt w/ 1639 sxs

PERFORATIONS: Wasatch/Mesaverde 5,592'-8,323'

TUBING: 2 3/8" 4.7# J-55 tbg at 7214'

Tubular/Borehole Drift Collapse psi Burst psi Capacities
inches Gal.Ift. Cuftlft. Bbl.Ift.

2.375" 4.7# J-55 tbg. 1.901 8100 7700 0.1624 0.02171 0.00387

4.5" 11.6# I-80 3.875 6350 7780 0.6528 0.0872 0.0155

9.625" 32.3# H-40 8.845 1400 2270 3.3055 0.4418 0.0787
Annular Capacities

2.375" tbg. X 4 ½" 11.6# csg 0.4227 0.0565 0.01

4.5" csg X 9 5/8" 32.3# csg 2.478 0.3314 0.059

4.5" csg X 7.875 borehole 1.704 0.2278 0.0406

9.625" csg X 12 1/4" borehole 2.3428 0.3132 0.0558

9 .625" csg X 14" csg 3.4852 0.4659 0.083

14" csg X20" borehole 8.3232 1.1126 0.1982

GEOLOGICINFORMATION:

Formation Depth to top, ft.
Green River 795'
Mahogany 1253'
GRN 2223'
Wasatch 3832'
DKCYN 6624'

http://geology.utah.gov/online/ss/ss-144/ss-144pl1.pdf
USDW Elevation ~2,200' MSL
USDW Depth ~3,364' KBL

RECEIVED: Oct. 01,

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

LOVE1121-16B
648' FNL & 1630' FEL
NW/NE SEC. 16, T11S, R21E
Uintah County, UT

KBE: 5564' API NUMBER: 4304736254

GLE: 5540' LEASE NUMBER: ML-22347-A
TD: 8700" LAT/LONG: 39.866o1/-109.56883

CASING : 20" hole
14" 36.7# STL Conductor @ 40'
Cmt w/ 28 sxs

12 1/4" hole
9 5/8" 32.3# H-40 ST&C @ 1932'
Cmt w/ 660sxs

7 7/8" hole
4.5" 11.6# I-80 LT&C@ 8700'
Cmt w/ 1639 sxs

PERFORATIONS: Wasatch/Mesaverde 5,592'-8,323'

TUBING: 2 3/8" 4.7# J-55 tbg at 7214'

Tubular/Borehole Drift Collapse psi Burst psi Capacities
inches Gal.Ift. Cuftlft. Bbl.Ift.

2.375" 4.7# J-55 tbg. 1.901 8100 7700 0.1624 0.02171 0.00387

4.5" 11.6# I-80 3.875 6350 7780 0.6528 0.0872 0.0155

9.625" 32.3# H-40 8.845 1400 2270 3.3055 0.4418 0.0787
Annular Capacities

2.375" tbg. X 4 ½" 11.6# csg 0.4227 0.0565 0.01

4.5" csg X 9 5/8" 32.3# csg 2.478 0.3314 0.059

4.5" csg X 7.875 borehole 1.704 0.2278 0.0406

9.625" csg X 12 1/4" borehole 2.3428 0.3132 0.0558

9 .625" csg X 14" csg 3.4852 0.4659 0.083

14" csg X20" borehole 8.3232 1.1126 0.1982

GEOLOGICINFORMATION:

Formation Depth to top, ft.
Green River 795'
Mahogany 1253'
GRN 2223'
Wasatch 3832'
DKCYN 6624'

http://geology.utah.gov/online/ss/ss-144/ss-144pl1.pdf
USDW Elevation ~2,200' MSL
USDW Depth ~3,364' KBL

RECEIVED: Oct. 01,

http://geology.utah.gov/online/ss/ss-144/ss-144pl1.pdf


RECEIVED: Oct. 01, 2015

NBU 193 PLUG & ABANDONMENT PROCEDURE 

 

GENERAL 

 H2S MAY BE PRESENT.  CHECK FOR H2S AND TAKE APPROPRIATE PRECAUTIONS. 

 CEMENT QUANTITIES BELOW ASSUME NEAT CLASS G, YIELD 1.145 CUFT./SX.  IF A DIFFERENT 

PRODUCT IS USED, WELLSITE PERSONNEL ARE RESONSIBLE FOR CORRECTING QUANTITIES TO 

YIELD THE STATED SLURRY VOLUME.  WHEN SQUEEZING, INCLUDE 10% EXCESS PER 1000’ OF 

DEPTH. 

 TREATED FRESH WATER WILL BE PLACED BETWEEN ALL PLUGS INSTEAD OF BRINE. 

 ALL DISPLACEMENT FLUID SHALL CONTAIN CORROSION INHIBITOR AND BIOCIDE.  PREMIX 5 

GALLONS PER 100 BBLS FLUID. 

 NOTIFY APPROPRIATE AGENCY 24 HOURS BEFORE MOVING ON LOCATION. 

 A GPS READING WILL NEED TO BE TAKEN AT THE WELL SITE AND RECORDED IN OPENWELLS. 

PLEASE TAKE IT TO THE 6TH DECIMAL PLACE.  

 

 

PROCEDURE 

Note: Approx. 501 sx Class “G” cement needed for procedure & (1) 4.5” CIBP 

Note: No gyro survey on record for this wellbore. 

 

1. A GPS READING WILL NEED TO BE TAKEN AT THE WELL SITE AND RECORDED IN OPENWELLS. 

PLEASE TAKE IT TO THE 6TH DECIMAL PLACE.  

 

2. MIRU.  KILL WELL AS NEEDED.  ND WH, NU AND TEST BOPE. 

 

3. POOH W/ TBG & L/D SAME.  RU WIRELINE AND MAKE A GAUGE RING RUN TO CHECK FOR FILL. 

RUN GYRO SURVEY.  

 

4. PLUG #1, ISOLATE WASATCH/MESAVERDE PERFORATIONS (5592’-8323’): RIH W/ 4.5” CIBP. SET 

~ 5540’. RELEASE CIBP, PUH 10’, BRK CIRC W/ TREATED FRESH WATER. DISPLACE A MINIMUM 

OF 4.36 FT3 / 4 SX ON TOP OF PLUG. PUH ABOVE TOC (~5490’). REVERSE CIRCULATE W/ 

TREATED WATER (~24 BBLS). 

 

5.  PLUG #2, PROTECT TOP OF WASATCH (3832’): PUH TO ~3940’.  BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.  

DISPLACE 18.3 FT3/ 16 SX AND BALANCE PLUG W/ TOC @ ~3730’ (210’ COVERAGE).  PUH ABOVE 

TOC.  REVERSE CIRCULATE W/ TREATED WATER (~ 3.7 BBLS). 

 

6. PLUG #3, PROTECT USDW (3364’): PUH TO ~3490’.  BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.  DISPLACE 22.7 

FT3/ 20 SX AND BALANCE PLUG W/ TOC @ ~3230’ (260’ COVERAGE).  PUH ABOVE TOC.  REVERSE 

CIRCULATE W/ TREATED WATER (~ 14 BBLS). 

 

7. BACKSIDE SQUEEZE (2120’): POOH AND RIG UP WIRELINE. RIH WITH PERF GUNS FOR 4.5” 

CASING @ 4SPF/4’ GUN. PERFORATE CASING AT ~2120’ (TOC @ 3000’). POOH AND CONTROL 

WELL WITH FRESH WATER AS NECESSARY. RIH WITH 4.5 CICR AND SET 30’ ABOVE 

PERFORATIONS. POOH AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE. RIH WITH TUBING AND PUMP ~52 SX (205’ 

PLUS 30’ FOR RETAINER).  

 

 

8. PLUG #4, PROTECT TOP OF GRN (2223’):  STING OUT OF CICR AND DISPLACE 17.9 FT3/ 16 SX 

AND BALANCE PLUG W/ TOC @ ~2120’ (205’ COVERAGE).  PUH ABOVE TOC.  REVERSE CIRCULATE 

W/ TREATED WATER (~ 11.8 BBLS). 

 

9. BACKSIDE SQUEEZE (690’): POOH AND RIG UP WIRELINE. RIH WITH PERF GUNS FOR 4.5” CASING 

@ 4SPF/4’ GUN. PERFORATE CASING AT ~690’ (TOC PREVIOUS SQUEEZE @ 2120’). POOH AND 

CONTROL WELL WITH FRESH WATER AS NECESSARY. RIH WITH 4.5 CICR AND SET 30’ ABOVE 

PERFORATIONS. POOH AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE. RIH WITH TUBING AND PUMP ~223 SX (670’ 

PLUS 30’ FOR RETAINER).  

 
AKT 9/30/2015t 

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

NBU193PLUG&ABANDONMENTPROCEDURE

GENERAL
• H2S MAYBE PRESENT. CHECK FOR H2S AND TAKEAPPROPRIATE PRECAUTIONS.
• CEMENT QUANTITIES BELOW ASSUME NEAT CLASS G, YlELD 1.145 CUFT./SX. IF A DIFFERENT

PRODUCT IS USED, WELLSITE PERSONNEL ARE RESONSIBLE FOR CORRECTING QUANTITIESTO
YlELD THE STATED SLURRY VOLUME. WHEN SQUEEZING, INCLUDE 10% EXCESS PER 1000' OF
DEPTH.

• TREATEDFRESH WATERWILL BE PLACED BETWEENALLPLUGS INSTEADOF BRINE.
• ALL DISPLACEMENT FLUID SHALL CONTAIN CORROSION INHIBITOR AND BIOCIDE. PREMIX 5

GALLONSPER 100 BBLS FLUID.
• NOTIFYAPPROPRIATEAGENCY24 HOURS BEFORE MOVINGON LOCATION.
• A GPS READING WILL NEED TO BE TAKEN AT THE WELL SITE AND RECORDED IN OPENWELLS.

PLEASETAKE ITTO THE 6TH DECIMALPLACE.

PROCEDURE
Note: Approx. 501sx Class "G" cement needed for procedure & (1) 4.5" CIBP
Note: No gyro survey on record for this wellbore.

1. A GPS READING WILL NEED TO BE TAKEN AT THE WELL SITE AND RECORDED IN OPENWELLS.
PLEASETAKE ITTO THE 6TH DECIMALPLACE.

2. MIRU. KILLWELLAS NEEDED. ND WH, NU AND TEST BOPE.

3. POOH W/ TBG & L/D SAME. RU WIRELINE AND MAKEA GAUGE RING RUN TO CHECK FOR FILL.
RUN GYROSURVEY.

4. PLUG #1, ISOLATEWASATCH/MESAVERDE PERFORATIONS (5592'-8323'): RIH W/ 4.5" CIBP. SET
~ 5540'. RELEASE CIBP, PUH 10', BRK CIRC W/ TREATED FRESH WATER. DISPLACE A MINIMUM
OF 4.36 FT3 / 4 SX ON TOP OF PLUG. PUH ABOVE TOC (~5490'). REVERSE CIRCULATEW/
TREATEDWATER(~24 BBLS).

5. PLUG #2, PROTECT TOP OF WASATCH (3832'): PUH TO ~3940'. BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.
DISPLACE 18.3 FT3/ 16 SX AND BALANCEPLUG W/ TOC @ ~3730' (210' COVERAGE). PUH ABOVE
TOC. REVERSE CIRCULATEW/ TREATEDWATER(~ 3.7 BBLS).

6. PLUG #3, PROTECT USDW (3364'): PUH TO ~3490'. BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER. DISPLACE22.7
FT3/ 20 SX AND BALANCEPLUG W/ TOC @ ~3230' (260' COVERAGE). PUH ABOVETOC. REVERSE
CIRCULATEW/ TREATEDWATER(~ 14 BBLS).

7. BACKSIDE SQUEEZE (2120'): POOH AND RIG UP WIRELINE. RIH WITH PERF GUNS FOR 4.5"
CASING @ 4SPF/4' GUN. PERFORATE CASING AT ~2120' (TOC @ 3000'). POOH AND CONTROL
WELL WITH FRESH WATER AS NECESSARY. RIH WITH 4.5 CICR AND SET 30' ABOVE
PERFORATIONS. POOH AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE. RIH WITH TUBING AND PUMP ~52 SX (205'
PLUS 30' FOR RETAINER).

8. PLUG #4, PROTECT TOP OF GRN (2223'): STING OUT OF CICR AND DISPLACE 17.9 FT3/ 16 SX
AND BALANCEPLUG W/ TOC @ ~2120' (205' COVERAGE). PUH ABOVETOC. REVERSE CIRCULATE
W/ TREATEDWATER(~ 11.8 BBLS).

9. BACKSIDESQUEEZE (690'): POOH AND RIG UP WIRELINE. RIH WITH PERF GUNS FOR 4.5" CASING
@ 4SPF/4' GUN. PERFORATE CASING AT ~690' (TOC PREVIOUS SQUEEZE @ 2120'). POOH AND
CONTROL WELL WITH FRESH WATER AS NECESSARY. RIH WITH 4.5 CICR AND SET 30' ABOVE
PERFORATIONS. POOH AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE. RIH WITH TUBING AND PUMP ~223 SX (670'
PLUS 30' FOR RETAINER).

AKT 9/30/2015t

RECEIVED: Oct. 01,

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

NBU193PLUG&ABANDONMENTPROCEDURE

GENERAL
• H2S MAYBE PRESENT. CHECK FOR H2S AND TAKEAPPROPRIATE PRECAUTIONS.
• CEMENT QUANTITIES BELOW ASSUME NEAT CLASS G, YlELD 1.145 CUFT./SX. IF A DIFFERENT

PRODUCT IS USED, WELLSITE PERSONNEL ARE RESONSIBLE FOR CORRECTING QUANTITIESTO
YlELD THE STATED SLURRY VOLUME. WHEN SQUEEZING, INCLUDE 10% EXCESS PER 1000' OF
DEPTH.

• TREATEDFRESH WATERWILL BE PLACED BETWEENALLPLUGS INSTEADOF BRINE.
• ALL DISPLACEMENT FLUID SHALL CONTAIN CORROSION INHIBITOR AND BIOCIDE. PREMIX 5

GALLONSPER 100 BBLS FLUID.
• NOTIFYAPPROPRIATEAGENCY24 HOURS BEFORE MOVINGON LOCATION.
• A GPS READING WILL NEED TO BE TAKEN AT THE WELL SITE AND RECORDED IN OPENWELLS.

PLEASETAKE ITTO THE 6TH DECIMALPLACE.

PROCEDURE
Note: Approx. 501sx Class "G" cement needed for procedure & (1) 4.5" CIBP
Note: No gyro survey on record for this wellbore.

1. A GPS READING WILL NEED TO BE TAKEN AT THE WELL SITE AND RECORDED IN OPENWELLS.
PLEASETAKE ITTO THE 6TH DECIMALPLACE.

2. MIRU. KILLWELLAS NEEDED. ND WH, NU AND TEST BOPE.

3. POOH W/ TBG & L/D SAME. RU WIRELINE AND MAKEA GAUGE RING RUN TO CHECK FOR FILL.
RUN GYROSURVEY.

4. PLUG #1, ISOLATEWASATCH/MESAVERDE PERFORATIONS (5592'-8323'): RIH W/ 4.5" CIBP. SET
~ 5540'. RELEASE CIBP, PUH 10', BRK CIRC W/ TREATED FRESH WATER. DISPLACE A MINIMUM
OF 4.36 FT3 / 4 SX ON TOP OF PLUG. PUH ABOVE TOC (~5490'). REVERSE CIRCULATEW/
TREATEDWATER(~24 BBLS).

5. PLUG #2, PROTECT TOP OF WASATCH (3832'): PUH TO ~3940'. BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER.
DISPLACE 18.3 FT3/ 16 SX AND BALANCEPLUG W/ TOC @ ~3730' (210' COVERAGE). PUH ABOVE
TOC. REVERSE CIRCULATEW/ TREATEDWATER(~ 3.7 BBLS).

6. PLUG #3, PROTECT USDW (3364'): PUH TO ~3490'. BRK CIRC W/ FRESH WATER. DISPLACE22.7
FT3/ 20 SX AND BALANCEPLUG W/ TOC @ ~3230' (260' COVERAGE). PUH ABOVETOC. REVERSE
CIRCULATEW/ TREATEDWATER(~ 14 BBLS).

7. BACKSIDE SQUEEZE (2120'): POOH AND RIG UP WIRELINE. RIH WITH PERF GUNS FOR 4.5"
CASING @ 4SPF/4' GUN. PERFORATE CASING AT ~2120' (TOC @ 3000'). POOH AND CONTROL
WELL WITH FRESH WATER AS NECESSARY. RIH WITH 4.5 CICR AND SET 30' ABOVE
PERFORATIONS. POOH AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE. RIH WITH TUBING AND PUMP ~52 SX (205'
PLUS 30' FOR RETAINER).

8. PLUG #4, PROTECT TOP OF GRN (2223'): STING OUT OF CICR AND DISPLACE 17.9 FT3/ 16 SX
AND BALANCEPLUG W/ TOC @ ~2120' (205' COVERAGE). PUH ABOVETOC. REVERSE CIRCULATE
W/ TREATEDWATER(~ 11.8 BBLS).

9. BACKSIDESQUEEZE (690'): POOH AND RIG UP WIRELINE. RIH WITH PERF GUNS FOR 4.5" CASING
@ 4SPF/4' GUN. PERFORATE CASING AT ~690' (TOC PREVIOUS SQUEEZE @ 2120'). POOH AND
CONTROL WELL WITH FRESH WATER AS NECESSARY. RIH WITH 4.5 CICR AND SET 30' ABOVE
PERFORATIONS. POOH AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE. RIH WITH TUBING AND PUMP ~223 SX (670'
PLUS 30' FOR RETAINER).

AKT 9/30/2015t
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RECEIVED: Oct. 01, 2015

 

10. PLUG #5, PROTECT TOP OF MAHOGANY (1253’) & TOP OF GREEN RIVER (795’): STING OUT OF 

CICR AND DISPLACE 58.4 FT3 / 51 SX AND BALANCE PLUG W/ TOC @ ~690’ (670’ COVERAGE).  

PUH ABOVE TOC.  REVERSE CIRCULATE W/ TREATED WATER (~6 BBLS). 

 

11. BACKSIDE SQUEEZE (300’): POOH AND RIG UP WIRELINE. RIH WITH PERF GUNS FOR 4.5” CASING 

@ 4SPF/4’ GUN. PERFORATE CASING AT ~300’ (TOC PREVIOUS SQUEEZE @ 690’). POOH AND 

CONTROL WELL WITH FRESH WATER AS NECESSARY. RIH WITH 4.5 CICR AND SET 30’ ABOVE 

PERFORATIONS. POOH AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE. RIH WITH TUBING AND PUMP ~96 SX (300’ 

PLUS 30’ FOR RETAINER) OR UNTIL RETURNS ARE SEEN AT SURFACE.  

 

12. PLUG #6, FILL SURFACE HOLE:  POOH.  HOOK UP 1” PIPE AND PUMP 26.2 CUFT/23 SX OR 

SUFFICIENT VOLUME TO FILL 4 ½” CASING F/ 300’ TO SURFACE  

 

13. CUT OFF WELLHEAD AND INSTALL MARKER PER REGULATIONS. 

 

14. RDMO.  TURN OVER TO OPERATIONS FOR SURFACE REHAB.  SURFACE RECLAMATION TO BE 

PERFORMED IN ACCORDANCE TO REGULATIONS. 
 

AKT 9/30/2015 

 

 

 

 

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

10. PLUG #5, PROTECT TOP OF MAHOGANY(1253') & TOP OF GREEN RIVER (795'): STING OUT OF
CICR AND DISPLACE 58.4 FT3 / 51 SX AND BALANCEPLUG W/ TOC @ ~690' (670' COVERAGE).
PUH ABOVETOC. REVERSE CIRCULATEW/ TREATEDWATER(~6 BBLS).

11. BACKSIDESQUEEZE (300'): POOH AND RIG UP WIRELINE. RIH WITH PERF GUNS FOR 4.5" CASING
@ 4SPF/4' GUN. PERFORATE CASING AT ~300' (TOC PREVIOUS SQUEEZE @ 690'). POOH AND
CONTROL WELL WITH FRESH WATER AS NECESSARY. RIH WITH 4.5 CICR AND SET 30' ABOVE
PERFORATIONS. POOH AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE. RIH WITH TUBING AND PUMP ~96 SX (300'
PLUS 30' FOR RETAINER)OR UNTILRETURNS ARE SEEN ATSURFACE.

12. PLUG #6, FILL SURFACE HOLE: POOH. HOOK UP 1" PIPE AND PUMP 26.2 CUFT/23 SX OR
SUFFICIENTVOLUMETO FILL4 ½" CASING F/ 300' TO SURFACE

13. CUT OFF WELLHEADAND INSTALLMARKER PER REGULATIONS.

14. RDMO. TURN OVER TO OPERATIONS FOR SURFACE REHAB. SURFACE RECLAMATIONTO BE
PERFORMED IN ACCORDANCETO REGULATIONS.

AKT 9/30/2015
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Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

10. PLUG #5, PROTECT TOP OF MAHOGANY(1253') & TOP OF GREEN RIVER (795'): STING OUT OF
CICR AND DISPLACE 58.4 FT3 / 51 SX AND BALANCEPLUG W/ TOC @ ~690' (670' COVERAGE).
PUH ABOVETOC. REVERSE CIRCULATEW/ TREATEDWATER(~6 BBLS).

11. BACKSIDESQUEEZE (300'): POOH AND RIG UP WIRELINE. RIH WITH PERF GUNS FOR 4.5" CASING
@ 4SPF/4' GUN. PERFORATE CASING AT ~300' (TOC PREVIOUS SQUEEZE @ 690'). POOH AND
CONTROL WELL WITH FRESH WATER AS NECESSARY. RIH WITH 4.5 CICR AND SET 30' ABOVE
PERFORATIONS. POOH AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE. RIH WITH TUBING AND PUMP ~96 SX (300'
PLUS 30' FOR RETAINER)OR UNTILRETURNS ARE SEEN ATSURFACE.

12. PLUG #6, FILL SURFACE HOLE: POOH. HOOK UP 1" PIPE AND PUMP 26.2 CUFT/23 SX OR
SUFFICIENTVOLUMETO FILL4 ½" CASING F/ 300' TO SURFACE

13. CUT OFF WELLHEADAND INSTALLMARKER PER REGULATIONS.

14. RDMO. TURN OVER TO OPERATIONS FOR SURFACE REHAB. SURFACE RECLAMATIONTO BE
PERFORMED IN ACCORDANCETO REGULATIONS.

AKT 9/30/2015

RECEIVED: Oct. 01,



RECEIVED: Oct. 01, 2015

 

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000
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RECEIVED: Oct. 01,

Sundry Number: 66663 API Well Number: 43047362540000

NO OF SHEETS

09/

SUBJECT 11
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RECEIVED: Oct. 01,



RECEIVED: Jan. 06, 2016

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-22347-A 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 LOVE 1121-16B 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6507  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 LOVE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0648 FNL 1630 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

12/18 /2015

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP has plugged and abandoned the
LOVE 1121-16B well. Please see the operations summary report for

details. Thank you. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jennifer Thomas 720 929-6808

TITLE
 Regulatory Specialist

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 1 /6 /2016

January 07, 2016

Sundry Number: 68917 API Well Number: 43047362540000Sundry Number: 68917 API Well Number: 43047362540000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-22347-A

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well LOVE 1121-16B

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
KERR-MCGEE OIL & GAS ONSHORE, L.P. 43047362540000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
P.O. Box 173779 1099 18th Street, Suite 600, Denver, CO, 80217 3779 720 929-6 503VIExt

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

0648 FNL 1630 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NWNE Section: 16 Township: 11.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

12/18/2015
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Kerr-McGee Oil & Gas Onshore, LP has plugged and abandoned the Accepted by the
LOVE 1121-16B well. Please see the operations summary report for Utah Division of

details. Thank you. Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
January 07, 2016

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jennifer Thomas 720 929-6808 Regulatory Specialist

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 1/6/2016

RECEIVED: Jan. 06,



RECEIVED: Jan. 06, 2016

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report

Well: LOVE 1121-16B Spud date: 7/15/2006

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: LOVE 1121-16B Rig name no.: WESTERN WELL SERVICES 9/9

Event: ABANDONMENT End date: 12/18/2015Start date: 12/15/2015

Active datum: RKB @5,563.99usft (above Mean Sea 

Level)

UWI: LOVE 1121-16B

     Time     

Start-End

MD from

(usft)

Code Sub 

Code

P/U OperationPhaseDuration

(hr)

Date

12/15/2015 ABANDP 30 G P ROAD RIG FROM LOVE 1121-18D TO LOVE 

1121-16B, SPOT IN RIG, WILL RIG UP IN THE A.M. 

WHEN WE HAVE CEMENT BLOCKS

5.0016:0011:00 -

12/16/2015 ABANDP 48 P HSM, JSA0.25 7:15 7:00 -

ABANDP 30 A P MIRU, 200# FCP, CONTROL WELL W/ 20 BBLS 

T-MAC, ND WH, NU BOP'S, RU FLOOR & TBG EQUIP, 

SPOT IN PIPE WRANGLER & TRAILERS

2.7510:00 7:15 -

ABANDP 31 I P MIRU SCAN TECH, TOOH & SCAN 2-3/8" TBG, TBG 

SCAN SHOWED 94 YELLOW JTS, 30 BLUE JTS & 

103 RED JTS, JTS 144-160 HAD LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

EXTERNAL PITTING, RD SCAN TECH

4.0014:0010:00 -

ABANDP 34 I P MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE, RIH W/ GAUGE RING TO 

6680', POOH W/ GAUGE, RIH & SET CIBP @ 6650', 

POOH & RD CUTTERS

2.0016:0014:00 -

ABANDP 31 I P P/U 40 JTS TBG & TIH, SWI, DRAIN PUMP & LINES, 

SDFN

1.0017:0016:00 -

12/17/2015 ABANDP 48 P HSM, JSA0.25 7:15 7:00 -

ABANDP 31 I P 200# SICP, BLOW CSG DN TO TNK, P/U TBG & TIH 

TO CIBP @ 6650'

2.7510:00 7:15 -

ABANDP 51 D P MIRU PRO PETRO, WAIT FOR LOST WATER TRUCK 

DRIVER 1HR LATE, START FRESH WTR, MIX & PUMP 

10 SX CMT @ 15.8PPG, DISPLACE W/ T-MAC

1.5011:3010:00 -

ABANDP 31 I P TOOH & LD 36 JTS TBG, STAND THE REST BACK IN 

DERRICK

1.5013:0011:30 -

ABANDP 34 I P RIH & SET CIBP @ 5540', POOH W/ WIRELINE1.0014:0013:00 -

ABANDP 31 I P TIH W/ 2-3/8" TBG TO CIBP @ 5540'1.0015:0014:00 -

ABANDP 51 D P START FRESH WTR, MIX & PUMP 10 SX CMT @ 

15.8PPG, PUH TO 3940', MIX & PUMP 16SX @ 

15.8PPG, DISPLACE W/ T-MAC, PUH TO 3190', SWI, 

SDFN

2.0017:0015:00 -

12/18/2015 ABANDP 48 P HSM, JSA0.25 7:15 7:00 -

ABANDP 51 D P START FRESH WTR, MIX & PUMP 20SX @ 15.8PPG, 

DISPLACE W/ T-MAC, PUH TO 2325', START FRESH 

WTR, MIX & PUMP 34 SX @ 15.8PPG, DISPLACE W/ 

T-MAC, PUH TO 1360', START FRESH WTR, MIX & 

PUMP 51SX @ 15.8PPG, DISPLACE W/ T-MAC, 

TOOH & LD TBG

2.7510:00 7:15 -

ABANDP 34 H P RIH & PERF CSG @ 110', POOH W/ PERF GUN, 

COULD NOT CIRC, RIH & PERF CSG AGIN, STILL 

COULD NOT CIRC, POOH & RD CUTTERS

1.0011:0010:00 -

ABANDP 30 C P RD RIG, DIG AROUND WELLHEAD, CUT WELLHEAD 

OFF

1.5012:3011:00 -

ABANDP 51 D P RUN 100' OF 1" IN 4-1/2" & 25' IN  9-5/8" CSG 

STACKED OUT, MIX & PUMP 25 SX @ 15.8PPG & 

FILL TO SURFACE, RD PRO PETRO, WELD ON 

MARKER PLATE.

STATE REP RICHARD POWELL ON LOCATION.

LAT 39.86601LONG -109.56883

2.0014:3012:30 -

1/6/2016  5:16:23PM 1

Sundry Number: 68917 API Well Number: 43047362540000Sundry Number: 68917 API Well Number: 43047362540000

US ROCKIES REGION

Operation Summary Report

Well: LOVE 1121-16B Spud date: 7/15/2006

Project: UTAH-UINTAH Site: LOVE 1121-16B Rig name no.: WESTERN WELL SERVICES 9/9

Event: ABANDONMENT Start date: 12/15/2015 End date: 12/18/2015

Active datum: RKB @5,563.99usft(above Mean Sea UWl: LOVE 1121-16B

Level)

Date Time Duration Phase Code Sub P/U MD from Operation
Start-End (hr) Code (usft)

12/15/2015 11:00 - 16:00 5.00 ABANDP 30 G P ROAD RIG FROM LOVE 1121-18D TO LOVE
1121-16B, SPOT IN RIG, WILL RIG UP IN THEA.M.
WHEN WE HAVE CEMENT BLOCKS

12/16/2015 7:00 - 7:15 0.25 ABANDP 48 P HSM, JSA
7:15 - 10:00 2.75 ABANDP 30 A P MIRU, 200# FCP, CONTROL WELL W/ 20 BBLS

T-MAC, ND WH, NU BOP'S, RU FLOOR& TBG EQUIP,
SPOT IN PIPE WRANGLER& TRAILERS

10:00 - 14:00 4.00 ABANDP 31 I P MIRU SCAN TECH, TOOH & SCAN 2-3/8" TBG, TBG
SCAN SHOWED 94 YELLOW JTS, 30 BLUE JTS &
103 RED JTS, JTS 144-160 HAD LIGHT TO MEDIUM
EXTERNAL PITTING, RD SCAN TECH

14:00 - 16:00 2.00 ABANDP 34 I P MIRU CUTTERS WIRELINE, RIH W/ GAUGE RING TO

6680', POOH W/ GAUGE, RIH & SET CIBP @6650',
POOH & RD CUTTERS

16:00 - 17:00 1.00 ABANDP 31 I P P/U 40 JTSTBG & TlH, SWI, DRAIN PUMP& LINES,
SDFN

12/17/2015 7:00 - 7:15 0.25 ABANDP 48 P HSM, JSA
7:15 - 10:00 2.75 ABANDP 31 I P 2OO#SICP, BLOW CSG DN TO TNK, P/U TBG & TlH

TO CIBP @6650'
10:00 - 11:30 1.50 ABANDP 51 D P MIRU PRO PETRO, WAIT FOR LOST WATER TRUCK

DRIVER 1HR LATE, START FRESH WTR, MIX& PUMP
10 SX CMT @ 15.8PPG, DISPLACE W/ T-MAC

11:30 - 13:00 1.50 ABANDP 31 I P TOOH & LD 36 JTS TBG, STAND THE REST BACK IN
DERRICK

13:00 - 14:00 1.00 ABANDP 34 I P RIH & SET CIBP @ 5540', POOH W/ WIRELINE
14:00 - 15:00 1.00 ABANDP 31 I P TlH Wl2-3/8"TBG TO CIBP@ 5540'
15:00 - 17:00 2.00 ABANDP 51 D P START FRESH WTR, MIX& PUMP 10 SX CMT @

15.8PPG, PUH TO 3940', MIX& PUMP 16SX @
15.8PPG, DISPLACE W/ T-MAC, PUH TO 3190', SWI,
SDFN

12/18/2015 7:00 - 7:15 0.25 ABANDP 48 P HSM, JSA
7:15 - 10:00 2.75 ABANDP 51 D P START FRESH WTR, MIX& PUMP20SX @ 15.8PPG,

DISPLACE W/ T-MAC, PUH TO 2325', START FRESH
WTR, MIX& PUMP 34 SX @ 15.8PPG, DISPLACE W/
T-MAC, PUH TO 1360', START FRESH WTR, MIX &
PUMP 51SX @ 15.8PPG, DISPLACE W/ T-MAC,
TOOH & LD TBG

10:00 - 11:00 1.00 ABANDP 34 H P RIH & PERF CSG @ 110', POOH W/ PERF GUN,
COULD NOT CIRC, RIH & PERF CSG AGIN, STILL
COULD NOT CIRC, POOH & RD CUTTERS

11:00 - 12:30 1.50 ABANDP 30 C P RD RIG, DIG AROUND WELLHEAD, CUT WELLHEAD
OFF

12:30 - 14:30 2.00 ABANDP 51 D P RUN 100' OF 1" IN 4-1/2" & 25' IN 9-5/8" CSG
STACKED OUT, MIX& PUMP 25 SX @ 15.8PPG &
FILLTO SURFACE, RD PRO PETRO, WELD ON
MARKER PLATE.

STATE REP RICHARD POWELLON LOCATION.

LAT39.86601LONG -109.56883

1/6/2016 5:16:23PM 1

RECEIVED: Jan. 06,
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