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14421 County Rd. 10 » Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621  (303) 857-9999 = FAX (303) 857-0577 ¢ E-MAIL Perml-fco 1@aol.com

| November 12, 2004

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining - % o SO Ve . o
1594WestNorthTemple,Sulte1210’ e e e g Yy - RECEIVED

Salt Lake City, UT 841145801 | |
o g e ~ DIV.OFOIL, GAS & MINING

- Re: Gasoo Production Company
- Federal #12-209-19
1837'FNLand 846' FWL
- SW NW Section 20, T98 R19E
~_Uintah County, Utah
- Lease No. UTU-75090 4

,Gentlemen"'

Enelosed please fmd three coples of the Apphcatlon for Perm:t to Dnll along w1th one copy of the
Onshore Order No 1 which was fﬂed with the BLMin Vernal Utah. ,

If you should need addltlonal mformatlon, please don't hesitate to contact me. Approved coples of the ’
A.P.D. should be sent to Permltco lnc at the address shown above :

Sincekrely,
 PERMITCOINC. - ’
\fM\MSM OQ%MM
Venessa Langmacher -
Consultant for
Gasco Production Company
Enc.

cc:  Gasco Production Company?E~nglewood, co
Shawn Elworthy - Roosevelt, UT



’ . STATE OF UTAH .
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 3

AMENDED REPORT ||
(highlight changes)

001

5. MINERAL LEASE NO.: 6. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL UTU-75090 BLM
1A, TYPE OF WORK: DR“.L m REENTER D DEEPEN I:I 7. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
N/A
B. TYPE OF WELL: OIL ':I GAS m OTHER SINGLE ZONE m MULTIPLE ZONE I:l 8. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gasco Production Company Federal #12-20-9-19
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: | 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: L A
14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #H236, Englewood, CO 80112 | 303-483-0044 Rivertiei ~ OO vetty B J/f{
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/AQTR, SECTIOI‘. TOWNSHIP, RANGE .
, - LoI55AX 40,0963 Y MERIDIAN:
AT SURFACE: 1837' FNL and 846' FWL Y 30294Y -109,910025| Sec. 20, T9S-R19E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: SW NW ,
14, DISTANCE IN MILES AND DIRECTION FROM NEARESTVTOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
Approximately 26 miles Southeast of Myton, UT Uintah UTAH
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) - j 16, NUMBER OF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
846' 680 40 Acres '
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET):
3000' 11,940' , Bond #UT-1233
21, ELEVATIONS (SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATE DATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:
4810' GL Upon Approval 30 Days
24, PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT | SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD, AND SLURRY WEIGHT
17-1/2" 13-3/8", H-40, 48# 170' 180 sx Class G with 2% CaCl2, Yield 1.18
12-1/4" 8-5/8", J-55, 324# 3,720' | 631 sx Hi-Lift, 11 ppg, 3.91 yield + 185 sx 10-2 RFC, 14.2 ppg, 1.63 yield
7-7/8" 4-1/2", P-110, 13.5# 11,940"' | 366 sx Hi-lift, 11.5 ppg, 3.05 yield + 1480 sx 50/50 Poz 'G', 14.1 ppy, 1.28 yield
CEDENTALTIGHT HOLE
25, ATTACHMENTS

VERIFY THE FOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

COMPLETE DRILLING PROGRAM
D FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE OWNER

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINEER

EVIDENCE OF DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER

303-857-9999
Agent for Gasco Production Company

AGENT: PermitCo Inc. AGENT'S PHONE NO.:

NAME (PLEASE ’Y n _ Venessa Lapgmacher TITLE
SIGNATURE \ (%{OJ\Q‘ WM oate ___November 12, 2004
(This space for State use only) N
. . )
API NUMBER ASSIGNED: LH ‘(6 L’ 7 ';U 0 LLZ APPROVAL:

" Approvedbythe T2
_Utah Division o

(11/2001)

Fcﬁedgral Abprovaj of this
2T fs !‘u’scassary

OlL, GAS & MINING

DIV OF

.
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T9S, RI9E, S.L.B.&M

NBIBE22"W — 2637.32° (Meas.)

NBIBT717"W ~ 2639.19° (Meas.)

7910 Brass Cap, __l
0.5° High, N-S
Fenceline

1910 Brass

of Stones

1837

0.5 High, Pile

Cap, 7910 Brass Cop,
1.3° High, Scattered

Stones

S000217"W — 2639.97° (Meas.)

L 54" @ rEpERAL #12-20-9-19

NOOO2'39"F — 2638.96" (Meas.)

S00°0237"W — 2640.69° (Meas.)

1910 Brass Cap,
1.2° High, Pile
of Stones, N~S
Fenceline

1910 Brass Cap,
1.0° High, Pile
of Stones

S8959'48"F — 2638.00° (Meas.)

S89'59°E — 2639.34" (G.L.0.)

(AUTONOMOUS NAD 83)

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY :

Well location, FEDERAL #12—20-9-19, located
as shown in the SW 1/4 NW 1/4 of Section 20,
T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah.

BASIS OF ELEVATION

SPOT ELEVATION AT THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF SECTION
21, 795, R19E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE UTELAND BUTTE
QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
ELEVATION IS MARKED AS BEING 4711 FEET.

Elev. Ungraded Ground = 4810°
1970 Brass Cap,
Rotted Off Pipe,
A 2 0 A Set ULLS. Alum.

1910 Bross Cap, Cap ”7.0 High on

1.2° High, N-S 3/4" Rebar

Fenceline ° N .
~ o (@] (@]
< = B ° S
— = =
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8 SCALE
=
a CERTIFICATE
| THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM

FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE X i oy ﬂﬂDiER MY
b SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME CT TO THE‘
BASIS OF BEARINGS o BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BE .~ 77X s
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. 8 >

=z

gggﬁmaw *.i ;

%&\TE o uTKA
X ST - ;;g~ 3
UnTaH ENGINEERING  £% KNR}F%&&@YING

85 SOUTH 200 EAST -
(435) 789-1017

LEGEND: LATITUDE = 40°01°06.99” (40.018608) SCALE DATE SURVEYED:  |DATE DRAWN.
] LONGITUDE = 109°48'38.63" (109.810731) 1" = 1000’ 10-11-04 10-12-04
L = o0 svmeoL (AUTONOMOUS NAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES
® - PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE = 40°01°07.12” (40.018644) - B.B. TH ECO G.L.O. PLAT
. » » ATHER FILE
A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE = 109°48'36.12" (109.810033) WARM GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY




CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1

Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil & Gas Leases

FEDERAL #12-20-9-19
1837' FNL and 846' FWL
SW NW Section 20, T9S - R19E
Uintah County, Utah

Prepared For:

Gasco Production Company

By:
o
PERMITCO INC. \%\ :
14421 County Road 10 \\Q}
Ft. Lupton, Colorado 80621 ﬁ,ﬁ\?\:
303/857-9999 PR
mg\:%@
3

Copies Sent To:

3 - Bureau of Land Management - Vernal, UT
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining - SLC, UT
- Gasco Production Company - Englewood, CO
1 - Shawn Elworthy - Roosevelt, UT
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1 .
’

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRICZOR REENTER
24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

-

1.  Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Attached.

2. A Drilling Plan

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the SUPO shall be filed with the Appropriate Forest
Service Office.
See Surface Use Plan Attached.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see Item 20).
Bond coverage for this well is provided by Gasco Production Company under their BLM Bond No. Bond #UT-1233.

5. Operator certification.
Please be advised that Gasco Production Company is considered to be the operator of the above mentioned well.
Gasco Production Company agrees to be responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations
conducted upon the leased lands.

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the authorized officer.



ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 . ’ QDNFIDENTlAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Federal #12-20-9-19 ' Lease No. UTU-75090
1837' FNL and 846' FWL

SW NW Section 20, T9S - R19E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 1

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with applicable
laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, and the approved plan of operations. The
operator s fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished
the field representative to insure compliance.

1. ESTIMATED TOPS OF IMPORTANT GEOLOGIC MARKERS

KB =4,820'

Formation Depth Subsea
Wasatch 5,527 +707'

Mesa Verde 9,262' +4,442'

Castlegate 11,742 +6,922'

T.D. ' 11,940' +7,120'

2, ESTIMATED DEPTH OF ANTICIPATED WATER, OIL, GAS OR MINERAL FORMATIONS:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas Wasatch 6,000' - 9,262'
Gas Mesaverde 9,262' - 11,742'

All fresh water prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be recorded
by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to determine
- commercial potential. '




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 BNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Federal #12-20-9-19 - Lease No. UTU-75090
1837' FNL and 846' FWL

SW NW Section 20, T9S - R19E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 2

3.

PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT

Gasco Production Company’s minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are as follows:

Ram Type: 11" Hydraulic double with annular, 5000 psi w.p.

Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack working pressure

if isolated by test plug or to 70 percent of internal yield pressure of casing. Pressure shall be
maintained for at least 10 minutes or until requirements of test are met, whichever is longer. [f a test

plug is utilized, no bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizing a test plug, if a decline.in... ..
pressure of more than 10 percent in 30 minutes occurs, the test shall be considered to have failed.

Valve on casing head below test plug shall be open during test of BOP stack.

Annular type preventers (if used) shall be tested to 50 percent of rated working pressure. Pressure
shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or until provisions of test are met, whichever is longer.

As a minimum, the above test shall be performed:

a when initially installed;

b. whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
c following related repairs; and

d at 30-day intervals

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all down stream valves
open.

When testing the kil line valve(s) the check valve shall be held open or the ball removed:
Annular preventers shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need not be performed more
than once a day.

A BOPE pit level drill shall be conducted weekly for each drilling crew.
Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment.

All of the above described tests and/or drills shall be recorded in the drilling log.

PERMITCO)

’ P e
Noypast”




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Federal #12-20-9-19 Lease No. UTU-75090
1837' FNL and 846' FWL

SW NW Section 20, T9S - R19E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 3

BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted before drilling out
from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in place. Blowout preventer controls
will be installed prior to drilling the surface casing plug and will remain in use until the well is completed
or abandoned. Preventers will be inspected and operated at least daily to ensure good mechanical
working order, and this inspection will be recorded on the daily drilling report. Preventers will be
pressure tested before drilling casing cement plugs.

The District Office should be notified, with sufficient lead time, in order to have the BLM representative
on location during pressure testing. '

a.

The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram. Although arig has

" not been chosen to drill this well, most of the equipment for this depth of hole in the area use

a 11", 5000 psi working pressure blowout preventor.

A choke line and a kill line are to be properly installed. The kill line is not to be used as a
fill-up line.

The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide for repeated operation of
hydraulic preventers.

Drill string safety valve(s), to fit all tools in the drill string, are to be maintained on the rig floor
while drilling operations are in progress.

PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM:

a.

The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved to protect
and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones, lost circulation zones,
abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively valuable deposits of minerals. Any
isolating medium other than cement shall receive approval prior to use. The casing setting
depth shall be calculated to position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which
will contain the maximum pressure to which it will be -exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all relevant factors,
including; presence/absence of hydrocarbons; fracture gradients; usable water zones;
formation pressures; lost circulation zones; other minerals; or other unusual characteristics.
All indications of usable water shall be reported.

Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.4 to 0.50 psi per foot for
exploratory wells (lacking better data).




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 BNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company : ,
Federal #12-20-9-19 Lease No. UTU-75090

1837' FNL and 846' FWL

SW NW Section 20, T9S - R19E DRILLING PROGRAM

Uintah County, Utah Page 4
C. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi per foot for exploratory

wells (lacking better data)

Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches of all sides in the hole/casing
annulus, with recognition that variances can be granted for justified exceptions.

All waiting on cement times shall be adequate to achieve a minimum of 500 psi compressive
strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

All casing except the conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and tested used casmg
that meets or exceeds API standards for new casing.

The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary cement job
or by remedial cementing. '

All indications of usable water shall be reported to the authorized officer prior to running the
next string of casing or before plugging orders are requested, whichever occurs first.

Three centralizers will be run on the bottom three joints of surface casing with a minimum of
one centralizer per joint starting with the shoe joint.

Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement fluid. A bottom
plug or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush fluid, inner string cement
method, etc. shall be utilized to help isolate the cement from contamination by the mud fluid
being displaced ahead of the cement slurry.

All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressure tested to 0.22 psi per foot of casing
string length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed 70 percent of the minimum
internal yield. If pressure declines more than 10 percent in 30 minutes, corrective action shall
be taken.

On all exploratory wells, and on that portion of any well approved for a 5M BOPE system or
greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be performed. Formation at the
shoe shall be tested to a minimum of the mud weight equivalent anticipated to control the
formation pressure to the next casing depth or at total depth of the well. This test shall be
performed before drilling more than 20 feet of new hole.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 ’ gNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Federal #12-20-9-19 Lease No. UTU-75090
1837' FNL and 846' FWL
SW NW Section 20, TS -R19E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah , Page 5
m. The proposed casing program will be as follows:
Purpose Depth Hole Size | 0O.D. Weight Grade | Type | New/Used
Conductor 0-170' ~ | 1741/2* | 13-3%8"| 48% | H-40 | ST&C | New
Surface 0-3,720' 12-1/4" 8-5/8" 32# | J-bB5 ST&C New
Production 0-11,940° 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 | LT&C New
n. Casing design subject to revision based on geoclogic conditions encountered.
0. The cement program will be as follows:
Conductor ' Type and Amount
0-170' 180 sx Class G with 2% CaCl2, 1.18 yield

Cement will be circulated to surface

Surface Type and Amount

0-3720' Lead: 631 sx Hi-Lift, 11 ppg, Yield 3.91
Tail: 185 sx 10-2 RFC, 14.2 ppg, Yield 1.63
‘Cement will be circulated to surface

Production Type and Amount

2,500-11,900' Lead: 366 sx Hi-Lift, 11.5 ppg, Yield 3.05
Tail: 1480 sx 50:50 Poz G, 14.1 ppg, Yield 1.28

p. Anticipated cement tops will be reported as to depth; not the expected number of sacks of
cement to be used. The District Office should be notified, with sufficient lead time, in order
to have a BLM representative on location while running all casing strings and cementing.

Q. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing string shall stand cemented until
the cement has reached a compressive strength of at least 500 psi at the shoe. WOC time
shall be recorded in the driller's log.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 QNFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE

Gasco Production Company

Federal #12-20-9-19 Lease No. UTU-75090
1837' FNL and 846' FWL '

SW NW Section 20, T9S - R19E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 6

r The following reports shall be filed with the District Manager within 30 days after the work is
completed.

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5 (formerly 9-331) "Sundry Notices and Reports on
Wells", must include complete information concerning:

a. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size, grade, weight of casing
set, hole size, setting depth, amounts and type of cement used, whether
cement circulated or the top of the cement behind the casing, depth of
cementing tools used, casing test method and results, and the date work
was done. Show the spud date on the first reports submitted.

b. Temperature or bond logs must be submitted for each well where the casing
cement was not circulated to the surface.

S. Augxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:
1. Kelly cock
2. No bit float is deemed necessary.
3. A sub with a full opening valve.

5. MUD PROGRAM

a. The proposed circulating mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:
Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. F/L pH
0-3,720¢ Fresh Water
3,720 - 9,000 Native Mud 8.4-8.8
9,000' - 11,940' DAP Mud 9.0-11.1 30-40 15-20 7-8

There will be sufficient mud on location to control a blowout should one occur.
A mud test shall be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to determine, as applicable:
density, viscosity, gel strength, static filtration loss, and Ph.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 gNFlDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
Gasco Production Company

Federal #12-20-9-19 Lease No. UTU-75090
1837' FNL and 846' FWL
SW NW Section 20, T9S - R19E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 7
b. Mud monitoring equipment to be used is as follows:
1. Periodic checks will be made each tour of the mud system. The mud level will be

checked visually. :

C. No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and/or Indian lands without
prior BLM approval to ensure adequate protection of fresh water aquifers.

d. No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title Il in an amount equal to or greater than
10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in
association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no exiremely hazardous substances,
as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be-used, produced, stored,
transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

e. The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

6. EVALUATION PROGRAM
The anticipated type and amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:

a. No drill stem tests are anticipated, however, if DST's are run, the following requirements will
be adhered to:

Initial opening of drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours unless specific
approval to start during other hours is obtained from the authorized officer. However, DST's
may be allowed to continue at night if the test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate
of flow is stabilized and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is adequate for
visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can be released, but tripping shall not
begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained from the authorized officer. Closed
chamber DSTs may be accomplished day or night.

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall be either reversed out
of the testing string under controlled surface conditions. This would involve provided some
means for reverse circulation.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly installed before
a test starts.

spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.




' ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 gNFlDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
| Gasco Production Company |
‘ Federal #12-20-9-19 Lease No. UTU-75090
1837' FNL and 846' FWL :
SW NW Section 20, T9S - R19E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 8
b. The logging program will consist of a Schlumberger Platform Express from TD to the Base
of Surface Casing.
C. No cores are anticipated.
d. Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30 days after
completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with
43 CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data,
geologic summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled
during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, will be filed with form 3160-4.
Samples (cutting, fluids, and/or gases0 will be submitted when requested by the authorized
officer (AO).
e. The anticipated completion program is as follows: Perform multistage fracturing on all
productive sands.
f. Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to the BLM in Vernal on a

weekly basis.

7. ABNORMAL TEMPERATURES OR PRESSURES

a.

The expected bottom hole pressure is 6891 psi. The maximum bottom hole temperature
anticipated is 210 degrees F.

No hydrogen sulfide gas is anticipated. Abnormal pressures will be controlled with mud
weight and 5000# BOP and rotating head.

8. ANTICIPATED STARTING DATES AND NOTIFICATION OF OPERATIONS

Drilling is planned to commence upon approval of this APD.
It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately 30 days.

The BLM in Vemal, Utah shall be notified of the anticipated date of location construction
commencement and of anticipated spud date.
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d.

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the AO. If operations are to be suspended, prior approval of the AO will be
obtained and notification given before resumption of operations.

The spud date will be reported orally to the AO within 48 hours after spudding. If the
spudding occurs on a weekend or holiday, the report will be submitted on the following regular
work day. The oral report will be followed up with a Sundry Notice.

In accordance with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, this well will be reported on Form 3160-
6 "Monthty Report of Operations®, starting with the month in which operations commence and
continue each month until the well is physically plugged and abandoned. This report will be
filed with the Vernal BLM District Office, 170 South 500 East, Vernal, UT 84078.

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, orany other unusual occurrences
shall be promptly reported in accordance with the requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, & "Sundry Notice" Form 3160-
5 1o that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved
plan are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AC will be notified when the
well is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be sent by telegram or other written
communications, not later than 5 days following the date on which the well is placed on
production.

Pursuant to Onshore Order No. 7, with the approval of the District Engineer, produced water
may be temporarily disposed of into unlined pits for a period of up to 90 days. During the
period so authorized, an application for approval of the permanent disposal method, along
with the required water analysis and other information, must be submitted to the District
Engineet.

Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare gas during initial well
evaluation tests, not exceeding a period of 30 days or the production of 50 MMCF of gas,
whichever occurs first. An application must be filed with the District Engineer and approval
received, for any venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial 30 day or authorized test period.
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l. A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.9.d.), shall be submitted to
the appropriate District Office within sixty (60) days of installation or first production,
whichever occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Order No. 3 shall
be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be
effectively sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.4.).

m. A first production conference will be scheduled within 15 days after receipt of the first
production notice.

n. No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior approval of the AO.
In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergency situations, oral approval
will be obtained from the SO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be
filed with the AO within 30 days following completion of the well for abandonment. This report
will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Final
abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by the
approved APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of
the AO or his representative, or the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.

0. Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, lessees and operators have the responsibility
to see that their exploration, development, production, and construction operations are
conducted in a manner which conforms with applicable Federal laws and regulations and with
State and local laws and regulations to the extent that such State and local laws are
applicable to operations on Federal or Indian lands.

Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East
‘ Vernal, Utah 84078
Phone: 435/781-4400 Fax: 435/781-4410
After Hours:
Ed Forsman Petroleum Engineer 435/828-7874
Kirk Fleetwood Petroleum Engineer 435/828-7875
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Location Construction -
Location Completion -
Spud Notice

Casing String and
Cementing

BOP and Related
Equipment Tests

First Production -
Notice

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS
forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and access roads.
prior to moving on the drilling rig.
at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.

twenty-four (24) hours prior to running casing and
cementing all casing strings.

twenty-four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
within five (5) business days after new well begins or

production resumes after well has been off production for more than
ninety (90) days.

The onsite inspection for the subject well site was conducted on Wednesday, October 27, 2004 at
approximately 11:30 a.m. Weather conditions were cool and rainy. In attendance at the onsite inspection

were the following individuals:

Stan Olmstead
Lisa Smith

Hal Marshall
Shawn Elworthy

1. EXISTING ROADS

Natural Resource Specialist Bureau of Land Management
Permitting Agent Permitco Inc.

Civil Engineer Uintah Engineering and Land Surveying
Productions Superintendent Gasco Production Company

a. The proposed well site is located approximately 26 miles southeast of Myton, Utah.

b. Directions to the location from Myton, Utah are as follows:
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Proceed southwesterly on Highway 40 for 1.5 miles. Turn left and proceed southeasterly
for approximately 11 miles to the Castle Peak Mine. Turn left and proceed east for
approximately 11.6 miles on the 8 mile flat road. Turn right and proceed southwesterly on
an improved road for 0.4 miles. Continue southerly an additional 0.6 miles on a Class D
County Road. Tum right on the new access road and proceed westerly for 0.3 miles to '

the location.
C. For location of access roads within a 2-Mile radius, see Maps A & B.
d. Improvement to existing main roads will not be required.
e. All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all drilling and

completion operations associated with this well.
f. Existing roads and newly constructed roads on surface under the jurisdiction of any
Surface Managing Agency shall be maintained in accordance with the standards of the
SMA.
2. PLANNED ACCESS ROADS

a. Approximately 0.3 miles of new construction will be necessary. The remainder of the
access road is a Class D County Road.

b. The maximum grade of the new construction will be approximately 3%.

C. No turnouts are planned.

d. No low water crossings or culverts will be necessary.

e. The last 0.3 miles of new access road was centerline flagged at the time of staking.

f. The use of surfacing material is not anticipated, however it may be necessary depending

on weather conditions.

0. No cattle guards will be necessary.

IPERMITCO)

Coppsy
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h. Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the approved location and

approved access route. Any additional area needed will be approved in advance.

Access roads and surface disturbing activities will conform to standards outlined in the
Bureau of Land Management and Forest Service publication: Surface Operating
Standards for Qi and Gas Exploration and Development, (1989).

The road will be constructed/upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated traffic flow
and all weather road requirements. Construction/upgrading shall include ditching,
draining, graveling, crowing and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well
constructed safe road. Prior to upgrading, the road shall be cleared of any snow cover
and allowed to dry completely. Traveling off the 30 foot right-of-way will not be allowed.
Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing type.
Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause siltation or accumulation of debris in
the drainage crossing nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Erosion of
drainage ditches by runoff water shall be prevented by diverting water off at frequent
intervals by means of cutouts. Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions.
Should mud holes develop, they shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title Iil in an amount equal to or greater
than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually
in association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous
substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used,
produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

No road right of way will be necessary.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1-MILE RADIUS OF THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

(See Map “C")

a.

b.

o

o

Water wells - none
Injection wells - none
Producing wells - four

Drilling wells - none




- o

f.
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e. Shut-in wells - one

Temporarily abandoned wells - none
Disposal wells -none
Abandoned wells - three

Dry Holes - none

4. LOCATION OF TANK BATTERIES AND PRODUCTION FACILITIES. -

a.

All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed or installed
(including oil well pump jacks) will be painted Carlsbad Canyon. All facilities will be
painted within six months of installation. Facilities required to comply with the
Occupational Safety and Health Act (OSHA) will be excluded.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the facility/battery or the
well pad shall surrounded by a containment dike of sufficient capacity to contain at a
minimum, the entire contents of the largest tank within the facility/battery, unless more
stringent protective requirements are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

If production is established a production facility fayout will be submitted via Sundry Notice.
All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.

Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the wellhead. The gas flow
line will be buried or anchored down from the wellhead to the meter and 500 feet
downstream of the meter run or any production facilities. Meter runs will be housed
and/or fenced. '

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location. The oil and
gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. Tests for meter accuracy will
be conducted monthly for the first three months on new meter installations and at least
quarterly thereafter. The AO will be provided with & date and time for the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports
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will be submitted to the Vernal Field Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform
with Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil and Gas
Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement. '

If at any time the facilities located on public land and authorized by the terms of the lease
are no longer included in the lease (due to a contraction in the unit or other lease or unit
boundary change), BLM will process a change in authorization to the appropriate statute.
The authorization will be subject to appropriate rental or other financial obligation as
determined by the authorized officer.

Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife entry.

All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will be adhered to.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease will
have prior written approval from the District Manager.

All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and accommodate
year-round traffic.

The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

Produced water will be stored in a 300 bbl heated, insulated tank, then hauled to a
commercial disposal site such as Disposal Inc., or Brennan Bottom.

Pipelines will follow the route shown on Map D. See Pipeline detail attached.

LOCATION AND TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

a.

The proposed water source will be the Nebecker Water Service at the Nebecker Water
Station in Myton, permit #43-1723.

Water will be hauled by Nebecker Water Service to the location over the access roads
shown on Maps A and B.

No water well will be drilled on this lease.
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6. SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL

a. Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.
b. Any gravel used will be obtained from a commercial source.

C. The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform with 43 CFR 3610.2.3.
Construction material will not be located on lease.

d. No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.

7. METHODS OF HANDLING WASTE DISPOSAL

a. The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.

b. At the request of the BLM, the reserve pit will be fined with a 12 mil liner. If fractured rock
is encountered, the pit will be first lined with sufficient bedding (either straw or dirt) to
cover any rocks. The liner will overlap the pit walls and be covered with dirt and/or rocks
to hold it in place. No trash, scrap pipe, etc., that could puncture the liner will be disposed
of in the pit. More stringent protective requirements may be deemed necessary by the
AO.

C. Burning will not be allowed. All trash will be contained in a trash cage and its contents
removed at the end of drilling operations and hauled to an approved disposal sight.

d. After first production, produced waste water will be confined to a unlined pit or storage
tank for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days. During the 90-day period, in accordance
with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for approval of a permanent disposal method
and location, along with the required water analysis, will be submitted for the AQ's
approval. Failure to file an application within the time allowed will be considered an
incident of noncompliance.

e. Drill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

f. Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling system will be
disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.
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g. A chemical porta-toilet will be fumished with the drilling rig.
h. The produced fluids will be produced into a test tank until such time as construction of

production facilities is completed. Any spills of oil, gas salt water or other produced fluids
will be cleaned up and removed.

8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES

There are no airstrips, camps, or other facilities planned during the drilling of the proposed well.

9. WELL SITE LAYOUT

a. The operator or his/her contractor shall contact the BLM Office at 435/781-4400 forty-
eight (48) hours prior to construction activities.

b. The reserve pit will be located on the south side of the location.

C. The flare pit will be located on the west side of the reserve pit, a minimum of 100 feet
from the well head and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.

d. The stockpiled topsail (first six inches) will be stored on the southwest corner of the
location, between Corners 5, 6 and 7 near the wellpad. Topsoil along the access route
will be wind rowed on the uphill side.

e. Access to the well pad will be from the east as shown on the Pit & Pad Layout.
f. See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad and cuts and fills.
0. The location of mud tanks; reserve pit, trash cage; pipe racks; living facilities and soil

stockpiles will be shown on the Location Layout.
h. All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards: |
1. 39 inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand or barbed wire on top of

the net wire (barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of reinforcement
rod is attached to the top of the entire fence).
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2. The net wire shall be no more than 2-inches above the ground. The barbed wire
shall be 3-inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence shall be at least
42-inches.
3. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner to keep the

fence tight at all times.

4, Standard steel, wood, or pipe poéts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

5. All wire shall be stretched, by using a stretching device, before it is attached to
the corer posts. '

I The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on the fourth
side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and maintained until cleanup.

10. PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE

Producing Location

a. Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of all
unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash and junk not required for production.

b. Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be removed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

C. If a plastic nylon reinforced liner is used it shall be torn and perforated before backfilling of
the reserve pit.

d. The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production facilities or
operations will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours. The reserve pit will be
reclaimed within 120 days from the date of well completion. Before any dirt work takes
place, the reserve pit must have all fluids and hydrocarbons removed and all cans,
barrels, pipe, etc., will be removed.
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e. Reclamation of unused disturbed areas on the well pad/access road no longer needed for
operations, such as cut slopes, and fill areas will be accomplished by grading, leveling
and seeding as recommended by the Authorized Officer. A seed mixture will be specified
by the Bureau of Land Management in their Conditions of Approval for the subject well.

Seeding will be performed immediately after the location has been reclaimed and the pit
has been backfilled, regardless of the time of year. Seed will be broadcast and walked in

with a dozer.

f. The topsoil stockpile will be seeded as soon as the location has been constructed with the

same recomme_nded seed mix. The seed will be walked in with a cat.

g. The following seed mixture has been recommended by the BLM.
Species #/s per Acre
Shadscale 4
Four Wing Saltbush 4
Galleta Grass 4
TOTAL 12
Dry Hole
h. At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall submit a

subsequent report of abandonment and BLM will attach the appropriate surface
rehabilitation conditions of approval.

11. SURFACE OWNERSHIP

Access Roads - The majority of the access roads are maintained by the County Road Department

or the Bureau of Land Management.

Well pad - The well pad is located on lands managed by the BLM.

Lease No. UTU-75090

SURFACE USE PLAN
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12. OTHER INFORMATION

a. A Class Il archeological survey has been conducted by Grand River Institute. No
significant cultural resources were found and clearance is recommended. A copy of this
report will be submitted to the appropriate agencies by Grand River Institute.

b. A Paleontological Resource Inventory Report will not be required by the Bureau of Land
Management. '
C. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the areas who are associated with

this project that they will be subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing historic or
archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic of archaeological materials are
uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might further
disturb such materials, and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within five working days
the AO will inform the operator as to:

-whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of Historic Places;

-the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake before the site can be
used (assuming in situ preservation is not necessary); and

-a time frame for the AO to complete and expedited review under 36 CFR 800.11 to
confirm, through the State Historic Preservation Officer, that the findings of the AO are
correct and that mitigation is appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate
activities to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with this
process, the AO will assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization of
the exposed materials may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical and procedural guidelines for the conduct
of mitigation. Upon verification from the AO that required mitigation has been completed,
the operator will then be allowed to resume construction.

d. The operator will control noxious weeds along rights-of-way for roads, pipelines, well sites,
or other applicable facilities. A list of noxious weeds may be obtained from the BLM, or
the appropriate County Extension Office. On BLM administered [and it is required that a
Pesticide Use Proposal shall be submitted, and given approval, prior to the application of
herbicides or other pesticides or possible hazardous chemicals.
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e. Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this wellsite will not be

stacked or stored on Federal Lands after the conclusion of drilling operations or at any
other time without BLM authorization. However, if BLM authorization is obtained, it is only
a temporary measure.

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approved
plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully
responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be
furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

A complete copy of the approved APD shall be on location during construction of the
location and drilling activities.

There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or work over program without
prior approval from the AQ. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Al
wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended or abandoned will be identified in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.

"Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for approval for all
changes of plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of approval. An extension
period may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.
After permit termination, a new application will be filed for approval for any future
operations. '

The operator or his contractor shall contact the BLM Offices at 435/781-4400 48 hours
prior to construction activities.

The BLM Office shall be notified upon site completion prior to moving on the drilling rig.
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13. LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION

Permit Matters Drilling & Completion Matters
PERMITCO INC. Gasco Production Company

14421 County Road 10 14 Inverness Drive East, Suite H-236
Ft. Lupton, CO 80621 - Englewood, CO 80112
303/857-9999 (O) John Longwell

303/857-0577 (F) 303/483-0044 (O)

Lisa Smith 303/ 483-0011(F)

Shawn Elworthy - Field Superintendent
Roosevelt, UT
435-823-4272 (cell)

CERTIFICATION

| hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site and access route; that | am familiar with the conditions which presently exist; that the

- statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and, that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by Gasco Production
Company and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and
conditions under which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

November 12, 2004 \QNZ/OAO(%M\Q AU 4

Date: Venessa Langmachgr - PERMITCO INC.\
Authorized Agent for:
Gasco Production Company




10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

PIPELINE INFORMATION
Federal #1 2-20-9-19

The type of pipeline is a single well flow line.

The outside diameter (O.D.) of all will be 6 inches.

The anticipated production through the line is approximately 2000 MCF per day.
The anticipated maximum test pressure is 1000 psi.

The anticipated operating pressure is 850 psi.

Thé type of pipe is steel.

The method of coupling is welded.

There are no other pipelines to be associated in same right of way.- |

There are no other objects to be associated in the same right of way.

The total length of pipeline is approximately 5900 feet (all located on lease) - see
Map D. '

The line will be laid on the surface adjacent to the existing access road as shown
on Map D. '

Burying of the pipeline will not be necessary.

The construction width needed for total surface disturbing activities is 50 feet. The
permanent ROW requested is 30 feet.

The estimated total acreage involving all surface disturbing activities on BLM lands
(outside the lease boundary) is 4.06 acres.

Any surface disturbance created as a result of the pipeline construction will be
reclaimed utilizing the reclamation procedures and seed mixture specified by the
Bureau of Land Management.
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APPROXIMATE TOTAL PIPELINE DISTANCE = 5,900' +/-

LEGEND: GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD N FEDERAL #12-20-9-19

—————— EXISTING PIPELINE

___________ PO L SECTION 20, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.

1837' FNL 846' FWL
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GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR
FEDERAL #12-20-9-19
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GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY
- TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FOR
N N
I X‘sf“:l:m FEDERAL #12-20-9-19 \“\unm,,,
: SECTION 20, T9S, R1SE, S.L.B.&M. ) (,_g LANo
| 1" =50 1837 FNL 846" FWL .
DATE: 10-12-04
REVISED: 11-10-04
Drawn By: E.C.O.
65" 150’
- Finished Grade
— — cur
B
?9/7%3 1 1/2:1 U]—l Llllll_i__Fr—ﬂl_leﬁ 1.
STA. 3+80
|10 100’ 45’ 150°
— ] ZLOCA TION STAKE
cwr e T T L TSR T T Ty )
= o e
[i==i] u—m—f‘m—m—m—w—, :
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100’ 45’ 150’
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._”» __ T, r_l_l m—M’" ‘
==lI==]= STA. 0+55
//;:zgznstruction 45" 150’ :
T — — —\ L
Jd e T . —_
== === DT et U FILLYS
STA. 0+00 ‘
* NOTE:
FILL QUANTITY INCLUDES
APPROXIMATE YARDAGES 5% FOR COMPACTION
cuT EXCESS MATERIAL = 5010 Cu. Yds.
(6™) Topsoil Stripping = 2,050 Cu. Yds. . . .
Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 4,020 Cu. Yds.
Remaining Location = 9350 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)
EXCESS UNBALANCE = 990 Cu. Yds.
TOTAL CUT = 71,400 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)
FILL = 6,390 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (801) 789-1017




FEDERAL STIPULATIONS AND TIMING RESTRITIONS

Any wildlife stipulations that pertain to this lease will be attached as a
Conditional of Approval by the Bureau of Land Management.
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Archeology

A Class Il Archeological Survey has been conducted by Grand River Institute. No
significant cultural resources found and clearance has been recommended. A copy of this
report will be submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by Grand River Institute.
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Energy

Bur=au of Land Management
Vernal Field Office

170 S. 500 E.

Vernal, UT 84078

Atk Minerals

Re:  All Wells
- Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

This letter is to inform you that Permitco Inc. is authorized to act as Agent and to sign
documents on behalf of Gasco Production Company, a wholly owned subsidiary of Gasco
Enargy, Inc. when necessary for filing county, state and federal permits including Onshore
Order No. 1, Right of Way applications, etc., for the above mentioned well.

1t should be understood that Permitco is acting as Agent only in those matters stated
ahove and is not responsible for drilling, completion, production or compliance with

regulations.

Gasco Production Company agrees to accept full responsibility for operations conducted in
order to drill, complete and produce the above-mentioned weil.

Yaouys yery tr'uiy,

A /.,J L s
r/ ng”, "t/'l / { .

Mark J. Choury // /
Land Manager | /

61500 Energy. Inc.
14 ipveranss Drive East, Suite H-238 Tel: {303} 483-D044 Email:
Epzlewead, CO B0112-5825 Fay: 1303} 483-0011 Website: Wwww.G&SC0oEnargy.ccm

invest@gaszcensrgy.com



WORKSHEET
0()3 APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 11/15/2004 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-36093

WELL NAME: FEDERAL 12-20-9-19

OPERATOR : GASCO PRODUCTION ( N2575 )
CONTACT: VENESSA LANGMACHER PHONE NUMBER: 303-857-9999

PROPOSED LOCATION:

SHNW 20 090S 190E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SURFACE: 1837 FNL 0846 FWL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 1837 FNL 0846 FWL
UTINTAH Engineering
PARIETTE BENCH ( 640 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-75090

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal
PROPOSED FORMATION: MVRD

LATITUDE: 40.01863

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: -109.8100
RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:
_ v/ plat R649-2-3.
V Bond: Fed[1l] Ind[] Sta[] Feel] .
Unit
X (No. UT-1233 )
N Potash (Y/N) v _ R649-3-2. General
!\k 0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells
v// Water Permit ____ R649-3-3. Exception
(No. 43-1723 ) _ .
. ( - _  Drilling Unit
AN - RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:
(Date: )
Eff Date:
kl“ Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:
R649-3-11. Directional Drill
COMMENTS :
STIPULATIONS : [- L',anmlr\ &&2Pqu((/

- c&qpaunr nY
J
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OPERATOR: GASCO PROD CO (N2575)
SEC. 20 T9S R.I9E
FIELD: PARIETTE BENCH (640) ! l ,
COUNTY: UINTAH _/—’\\_f_k\
R iy
SPACING: R649-3-2 / GENERAL SITING . e
£ _ Utah Oil Gas and Mining
Wells Units.shp Fields.shp
#  GAS INJECTION [] ©XFLORATORY ABANDONED
L R e cassremack ] sctive
® NEWLOCATION [] ~FrroL [] comBINED N
& PLUGGED & ABANDONED [ ~esecoNpary [] macTIvE
% PRODUCING GAS [] renpine [ ] eroposeD
® PRODUCING OIL ] mon [] sToraGE
= :ng gﬁs [ rrcas [_| TERMINATED
X TEMP. ABANDONED [__| PPGEOTHERML a
o  TEST WELL ] rron
A WATER INJECTION [] sEconDary
¢  WATER SUPPLY [] TERMINATED PREPARED BY: DIANA WHITNEY
<  WATER DISPOSAL DATE: 16NOVEMBER-2004




OLENE S. WALKER

Governor

GAYLE FE. McKEACHNIE
Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah : November 16, 2004

Department of
Natural Resources

ROBERT L. MORGAN

Executive Director

Gasco Production Company
14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #1236

Division of Englewood, CO 80112
Oil, Gas & Mining
LOWELL P. BRAXTON - ' .
Division Director Re: Federal 12-20-9-19 Well, 1837' FNL, 846' FWL. SW NW, Sec. 20, T. 9 South,

R. 19 East, Uintah County., Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-36093.

Sincerely,

LA

<7€9r3 John R. Baza

Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc:  Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

Ulah!

; ' 14-5801
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 841 Where ideas connect™

telephone (801) 538-5340 ¢ facsimile (801) 359-3940-+ TTY (801) 538-7458 ¢ www.ogm.utah.gov
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Operator: Gasco Production Company

Well Name & Number Federal 12-20-9-19

API Number: 43-047-36093

Lease: UTU-75090

Location: _SW NW Sec._20 T. _9 South R. 19 East
Conditions of Approval

1. General

(98]

P

N

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
. Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
. Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.



#<T'orm 3160-3 . E @ E H w FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136
UNITED STATES NOV 1 5 2004 Expires November 30, 2000
N DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIO ' 5. Lease Serial No.
. _ BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT By ' UTU-75090
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
00 5 APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER N/A
la. Type of Work: m DRILL D REENTER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.
N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.
b. Type of Well: [_] ot wetl [y} Gas Well [ other [x} singte Zone  [_] Multiple Zone Federal #12-20-9-19
2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044 14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #H236 9. API Well No.
Gasco Production Company Englewood, CO 80112 % é//—? = /;/7(7
3. Name of Agent 303-857-9999 14421 County Road 10 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
Permiico inc, - Agent Fort Lupton, CO 80621 Riverbend
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements. ™) 11. Sec., T, R., M,, or Blk, and Survey or Area
At surface 1837' FNL and 846' FWL Section 20, T9S-R19E
At proposed prod. zone SWNW
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State
Approximately 26 miles Southeast of Myton, UT Uintah UT
15, Distance from proposed™ 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
location to nleareslt "
roperty or lease Ine, !
? lgo ttg,ncarest drig. unit line, if any) 846 680 40 Acres
13. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
1o n]ea(rie\;t well, ;linlllmg ctgmpleted
applied for, on thislease, ft. 3000' 11.940' _
’ Bond #UT-1233
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration
4810° GL ‘ Upon Approval 30 Days

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Qil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bondto cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan. ftem 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, 1 5. Operator certification.
SUPQ shall be filed with the appropnate Forest Servxce Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
w’ %-; ,} authorized office.
A Slvnature ! Name (Printed/Typed) ! Date
2\ O { %}\QYY\O[/C/KU | Venessa Langmacher ! 11/12/2004

Titd
Authorlzed Agent fo;ﬁas,qo,ﬂroducﬂop.Cqmpany

i Name (Printed/Typed)

: Date/ﬂﬁ/ZdV/ 5

MAMGBL [Office
Mineral Fieso s :

I
Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title 10 those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicantto
conduct operations thereon. 7 .

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. y éj

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*(Instructions on reverse) ad Py
NOTIOE D 5
,, 17 2005

o mJ/
ey
s
u.:

L —
—

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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COAs Page 1 0of 4
Well No.: Federal 12-20-9-19

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: Gasco Production Company

Well Name & Number: Federal 12-20-9-19

API Number: 43-047-36093

Lease Number: U-75090

Location;: _SWNW Sec. 20 T. 98 R. 19E

Agreement: __N/A

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval
for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR NOTICE TO DRILL

Approval of this application does not ‘warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease that would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well is
being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

1. Estimated Depth at Which Qil, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearing Zones are Expected
to be Encountered

Report ALL water shows and water-bearing sands to John Mayers of this office prior to setting
the next casing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies of State of Utah form
OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected, submit samples to this office
along with any water analyses conducted.



COAs Page 2 of 4
Well No.: Federal 12-20-9-19

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLM at onsite)
encountered during drilling will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas
shows will be tested to determine commercial potential.

2. Pressure Control Equipment

Chart recorders shall be used for all pressure tests.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while drilling
and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

3. Casing Program and Auxiliary Equipment

None

4, Mud Program and Circulating Medium

None

5. Coring, Logging and Testing Program

A Cement Bond Log will be required from production casing shoe to the intermediate casing.

Please submit to this office, in LAS format, an electronic copy of all logs run on this well.
This submission will replace the requirement for submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

6. Notifications of Operations
None
7. Other Information

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on lease or off-lease will have
prior written approval from the AO.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location. The oil and gas
meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries and tested for meter accuracy at least
quarterly thereafter. The AO will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will
be submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform to
Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 5 for
natural gas measurement.



COAs Page 3 of 4
Well No.: Federal 12-20-9-19

APD approval is valid for a period of one (1) year from the signature date. An extension period
may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Michael Lee (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435) 781-4410

' THERE ARE NO ADDITIONAL CONDITIONS FOR THE SURFACE USE PROGRAM.



COAs Page 4 of 4
Well No.: Federal 12-20-9-19

EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPT EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, they are not necessarily hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids

Gas plant cooling tower cleaning wastes

Painting wastes

Oil and gas service company wastes, such as empty drums, drum rinsate, vacuum truck rinsate,
sandblast media, painting wastes, spend solvents, spilled chemicals, and waste acids
Vacuum truck and drum rinsate from trucks and drums, transporting or containing nonexempt
waste

Refinery wastes

Liquid and solid wastes generated by crude oil and tank bottom reclaimers

Used equipment lubrication oils

Waste compressor oil, filters, and blowdown

Used hydraulic fluids

Waste solvents

Waste in transportation pipeline-related pits

Caustic or acid cleaners

Boiler cleaning wastes

Boiler refractory bricks

Incinerator ash

Laboratory wastes

Sanitary wastes

Pesticide wastes

Radioactive tracer wastes

Drums, insulation and miscellaneous solids



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

Well Name: FEDERAL 12-20-9-19

Api No: 43-047-36093 Lease Type: FEDERAL

Section__20 Township _09S Range _19E  County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor _ CRAIG’S ROUSTABOUT SERV_RIG# _RATHOLE

SPUDDED:
Date 10/06/05
Time 10:00 AM
How DRY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by, CRAIG OVERMILLER

Telephone # 1-435-828-7151

Date____ 10/11/05 __ Signed CHD




OCT 11 2005 8:33AM

HP_ LASERJET 3200

'STATE OF UTAH
_ DEPARTM_ENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 6

ENTITY ACTION FORM
Operator: _Gasco Energy, Inc Operator Account Number: N ﬁw’?’ 7 S
Address: 8 Invemess Drive East, Suite 100
city Englewood
state_Co zip 80112 Phone Number: (303) 483-0044
Well 1
APJ Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
4304736093 Federal 12-20-9-19 SWNW| 20 9 19 Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
. Number - Number Effective Date
EA 99999 114970 10772005 lofizfos |2
Comments: , )
New Drill r
o M URD CONFIDENTIAL
Weli 2
APl Number Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rng County
(1/ _430473660(_) Sheep Wash Federal 43-25-9-18 NESE 25 9 18 Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
B Number _ Number Effective Date
£ A 99999 144 77 101812005 ofiales |3
Comments: - i | - -
NewDit  ALKHK=MVED A r
CONFIDENTIAL
Well 3 A
API Number _ Well Name QQ | Sec | Twp | Rn County
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Eﬁecﬁve-vat_e
D
Comments: ]
acy 112
GAS & MINING
ACTION CODES: DIV, OF OlL,

A - Estabiish new entity for new wall (single well only)
B - Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Cther (Explain In ‘comments’ section)

(5/2000)

ignature
Engineering Tech 10/11/2005
Title Date




GASGO
Energy

RECEIVED
FEB 2 2 2006

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attn: Carol Daniels
February 15, 2006

Dear Ms Daniels:

Gasco Production Company will soon be drilling the Federal 12-20-9-19, SWNW 20-9S-
19E, Uintah County, Utah. The API Number for this well is 43-047-36093.

Gasco wishes to keep all information on this well CONFIDENTIAL for as long a period
as possible.

Yours truly,

Poin Do

Robin Dean
Senior Geologist
Gasco Energy, Inc.

8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100 Tel: (303) 483-0044 Email:  invest@gascoenergy.com
Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: (303) 483-0011 Website: www.gascoenergy.com

|
|
GASCO Energy, Inc.

AMEX: 68X




GASCQO ® GascoeEnNergy @

T DAILY DRILLING REPORT
nergy AFE#40026 T 075 R /95 S-30 Y 3-04n 3

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: RIG UP 2/24/2006 |Days: RU2
Depth: 3600 G.L.lProg: D Hrs: [AV ROP: Formation:

DMC: $0 ltmc: $0 TDC: $43,239 |cwe: $407,655
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST

Mw: #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move:

Ipvive: #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 16,650
Gel: SPM: jvrG: Prod Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 500
WL: GPM : S/N: iFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: tPress: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,807
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuen $ 20,882
Sand: AV DP: IDepth In: IPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

lpH : JetVel: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

IPfIMf: Jeco: l jHrs: Separator: $ - |cement: 3 -
Chlor: SPR #1 : IFPH: Heater: $ - |[sits: $ -
Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: JPumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: 3 -

|papp ppb: |Btm.up: ~ |R-RPM: IPrime Mover: $ - [Fishing: $ -

Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME ‘ Total Rot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -
06:00 18:00 12:00 IRIG UP NABORS 270 Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
18:00 Csg. Crew: 3 -
0 WORKING EXTRA CREW FOR RIG MOVE Daily Total: $ 43,239
0 BOTH TOOL PUSHERS Cum. Wir: $ 10,639
0 Cum. Fuel $ 20,882
0 Cum. Bits: $ -
0 BHA
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0 TOTAL BHA = 0.00
0 Survey
24.00 Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. Ki# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3502' G.L. PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO

Energy

® Gascoenergy @

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE #40026 7 095 A/JF 520 Y3-0y s 3Lo 93

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: RIG UP 2/25/2006 Days: RU3
Depth: 3600 G.L.lProg: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation:
DMC: $0 [tmc: $0 TDC: $43,239 |owe: $450,894
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit #: Conductor: 3 - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move:
PV/YP: #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: Int. Csg: 3 - Day Rate: $ 16,650
Gel: SPM: ImrG: Prod Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 500
WL: GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,807
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fue: $ 20,882
Sand: AV DP: |Depth In: Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: 3 -
IpH - Jetvel: FTG: Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PfIMf: ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : SPR #2 : WOB: lPumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: [Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: 3 - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: |Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ -
06:00 18:00 12:00 JRIG UP NABORS 270 Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
18:00 06:00 12:00 Csg. Crew: $ -
06:00 Daily Total: $ 43,239
0 Cum. Wtr: $ 10,639
0 Cum. Fuel $ 20,882
0 Cum. Bits: $ -
0 BHA
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0 TOTAL BHA = 0.00
0 Survey '
24.00 Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3502' G.L. PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO

Energy

. GASCO ENERGY ®
DAILY DRILLING REPORT o

AFE #40026 7095 ¢ )9F S0 Y7040 36od=

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: RIG UP 2/26/2006 IDays:  RU4
Depth: 3600 G.L.IProg: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation:
DMC: $0 lTmc: $0 TDC: $43,239 |cwe: $450,894
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 lMud Co: M-1 DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
fraw: #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm  |Bit #: Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move:
PVIYP: #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 16,650
Gel: SPM: |mFG: IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 500
WL GPM : S/N: IFIoat Equp: 3 - Trucking: $ -
Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,807
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ 20,882
Sand: AV DP: |Depth In: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
|PH : JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: ECD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: SPR#1: [Fen: Heater: $ - [sits: $ -
Ca : SPR#2: WOB: |PumpingLm: $ - |Mud Motors: 3 -
|Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: |R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME Total Rot. Hrs: lDain Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -
06:00 08:00 2:00 JRIG UP NABORS 270 CHECK DERRICK GET READY TO RAISE. Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
08:00 16:30 8:30 JRAISE DERRICK AND RIG UP FLOOR Csg. Crew: $ -
16:30 TRY TO TEST BOP's ONE GATE VALVE AND CHECK VALVE BAD, [Daily Total: $ 43,239
0 22:.00 5:30 |TEST STOPED UNTIL ALL VALVE ARE REPLACED Cum. Wtr: $ 10,639
22:00 06:00 8:00 JWORK ON BLOCKS AND WO VALVES, RIG UP Cum. Fuel $ 20,882
06:00 Cum. Bits: $ -
0 BHA
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0 TOTAL BHA = 0.00
0 Survey
24.00 Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3502' G.L. PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO

Energy

® GASCO ENERGY ®
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE #40026 7 093 RIJF S0 Y Fvyp 36023

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: PICK UP BHA 2/27/2006 |Days: RU5
Depth: 3530’ |Prog: D Hrs: [AV ROP: Formation:
DMC: $0 lTmc: $0 TDC: $40,432 fewc: $448,087
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-1 DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: F #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm  [Bit#: RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: R SPM: Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: 3 - Rig Move:
|pvrve: E #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Type: Jint. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 16,650
Gel: S SPM: IMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - Rentals: 3 500
WL: H GPM : SIN: IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: W |Press: Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: A AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuek $ 20,882
Sand: T AV DP: Depth in: |packers: $ - Mud Logger: 3 -
JPH : E Jetvel: IFTG: Tanks: $ - |Logging: 3 -
IPfIMf: R JECD: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: SPR #1 : IFPH: fHeater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : SPR#2: WOB: IPumping LT $ - Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: |Btm.Up: JR-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. 'M-RPM: |Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 14 Total Rot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ -
06:00 20:00 14:00 JWAIT ON CHECK VALVE AND GATE VALVE. INSTALL Misc. / Labor: $ 1,500
20:00 RU Quick Test - Test Blind Rams, Pipe Rams,Upper & Lower Kelly, Csg. Crew: $ -
Floor Valves, Kill Line & Choke Line Valve, Choke Manifold & Valves Daily Total: $ 40,432
ALL To 5000psi High & 250psi Low - Test AnuilarBOP To 2500psi Cum. Wtr: $ 7832
01:30 5:30 [Test Casing To 1500psi - All OK Cum. Fuel $ 41,764
01:30 06:00 4:30 }RIG UP AND PICK UP BHA & DP Cum. Bits: $ -
BHA
TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey
24.00 Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/I0 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3502' G.L. PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO ® GascoEneRgY @ 0

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE#40026 7 0,95 K )IE.S=20 Y3090 3677,
Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: WAIT ON ORDERS 2/28/2006 IDays: 1
Depth: 3626' lProg: 96 |DHrs: 1 ]AV ROP: 96.0 Formation:
DMC: $5319  |TMC: $5,319 TDC: $53,810 Jewe: $461,465
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 lMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
IMW: F #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit #: RR Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: R SPM: Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move:
fpvryp: E #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 16,650
Gel: S SPM: MFG: HTC 'Prod Csg: $ - Rentals: $ 500
WL: H GPM : SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: w lPress: Jets: 3X20 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: A AV DC: TD Out: 3626 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuen $ 20,882
Sand: T AV DP: IDepth In: 3445 JPackers: $ - Mud Logger: 3 -
PH : E Jetvel: IFTG: 181 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PfIMf: R ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: SPR #1 : FPH: JHeater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : SPR#2: WOB: IPumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: |Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. {M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 19 Total Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 5,319
06:00 | 7:30 | 1:30 |PICKUPDP Misc. / Labor: $ 1500
7:30 08:30 1:00 |TOOH 10 STD OF NEW HARD BANDED DP STD BACK Csg. Crew: $ 8,059
08:30 9:30 1:00 |LEVEL DERRICK Daily Total: $ 53,810
9:30 14:00 4:30 |PICK UP DP PICK UP KELLY PRESSURE TEST SURFACE EQUP.TO Jcum. Wtr: $ 7,832
14.00 17:30 3:30 |TAG CEMENT @3445' DRIG OUT FLOAT COLLAR AND SHOE Cum. Fuel $ 41,764
17:30 18:00 0:30 |LEVEL DERRICK Cum. Bits: $ -
18.00 19:00 1:00 [DRLG 3530 - 3626 BHA
19.00 20:00 1.00 |TOOH
20.00 23:00 3:00 JLEVEL DERRICK
23:00 01:00 2:00 JTOOH, SURVEY @ 3626- 2°
01:00 06:00 5:00 JWAIT ON ORDERS
TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey 2° 3626'
24.00 Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 Ki# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. Ki# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 893 On Hand: 7885 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO

Energy

® GASCO ENERGY ¢

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
AFE # 40026 7,7

0/ /E S0 L/G’w‘)%%£é73_

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: PICKING UP DP 3/1/2006 IDays: 2
Depth: 3626 lProg: 96 |DHrs: 1 IAV ROP: 96.0 Formation:
DMC: $5319  |T™c: $5,319 TDC: $38,595 |cwe: $446,250
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: F #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: R SPM: Size: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move:
PVIYP: E #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: DSX416 Jint. Csg: 3 - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: S SPM: MFG: HYC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: H GPM : SIN: 113676 Float Equp: 3 - Trucking: $ -
Cake: W Press: Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,267
Solids: A AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuer $ -
Sand: T AV DP: Depth In: 3626 JPackers: 3 - Mud Logger: $ 850
IPH : E JetVel: FTG: Tanks: 3 - Logging: $ -
Pf/Mf: R |ECD: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: SPR #1 : FPH: Heater: 3 - Bits: 3 -
Ca : SPR#2: 'WOB: IPumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: Btm.Up: R-RPM: Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 43 Total Rot. Hrs: |Daily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 5319
06:00 06:30 0:30 JWAIT ON ORDERS Misc. / Labor: $ 1,200
06:30 08:00 1:30 |MU BIT, BIT SUB Csg. Crew: $ 8,059
08:00 11:00 3:00 TH Daily Total: $ 38,595
11:00 12:30 1:30 JLEVEL DERRICK BACK TO NORMAL Cum. Wtr: $ 10,099
12:30 21:00 8:30 [JLAY DOWN PIPE Cum. Fuel $ 20,882
21:00 23:00 2:00 |MOVR RIG OVER CENTER OF HOLE 2" OFF Cum. Bits: $ -
23:00 06:00 7:00 MU BHA , PICK UP DC's AND DP TIH BHA
06:00 BIT 1 1.00
0 MM .16 35.45
0 IBS 4.54
0 SHOCK SUB 10.22
1 DC 29.7
IBS 4.63
20 DC's 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 686.41
Survey 2° 3626’
24.00 Survey
P/U K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 845 On Hand: 7885 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO

Energy

® GcAascoeEnergy @

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40026
Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/02/06 |Days: 3
Depth: 4999 |Prog:  1373' |DHrs:  181/2 |AVROP:  74.2 |Formation: Green River
DMC: $90 |TMC: $5,498 TDC: $171,503 |CWC: $750,661
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: F #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm  |Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: R SPM: Size: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ 139,035
PV/YP: E #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Type: DSX416 Int. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: S SPM: IMFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: H GPM : S/N: 113676 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: W JPress: Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: 3 -
Solids: A AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel $ -
Sand: T AV DP: [Depth In: 3626 [Packers: $ - Mud Logger: 3 850
JpH : E JetVel: FTG: 1373 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPf/Mf: R Jeco: fHrs: 18.5 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 10000 |JsPr#1: IFPH: 70.0 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 8,500
Ca : 160 SPR#2 : WOB: 7-15 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,128
IDapp ppb: |Btm.Up: |R-RPM: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-RPM: 65 Misc: $ - |consuitant: $ 900
START END TIME 43.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 19.5 |Daily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 90
06:00 07:00 1.00 |Pick Up Drill Pipe Misc. / Labor: $ -
07:00 08:30 1:30 |RD Laydown Machine - Pressure Test Mud Line To 2000psi Csg. Crew: $ -
08:30 09:00 0:30 JConduct Mud Equivilant Test - Pressure Shoe To 500psi - No Leak Off |Daily Total: $ 171,503
09:00 09:30 0:30 |Rig Service Cum. Wtr: $ 7,832
09:30 10:30 1.00 |Wash & Ream To Bottom Cum. Fuel $ 20,882
10:30 14:30 4:00 |Drilling 3626' - 3866' ( 240" @ 60fph) Cum. Bits: $ 8500
14:30 15: 00 0:30 |Rig Repair - Epoch Derrick Cable BHA
15: 00 19:00 4:00 |Drilling 3866' - 4145' (279" @ 69.8fph) BIT 1 1.00
19:00 19:30 0:30 |JRun WLS: 2° @ 4110' MM .16 35.45
19:30 06:00 10:30 |Drilling 4145' - 4999' ( 854' @ 81.3fph) IBS 4.54
SHOCK SUB 10.22
1DC 29.7
IBS 4.63
20 DC's 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 686.41
Survey 2° 3626'
24.00 Survey 2° 4110'
P/U 135 K# LITH: 60% Sand 40% Shale & Silt BKG GAS 46
S/0 125 K# FLARE: N/A CONN GAS 573
ROT. 130 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 1083
FUEL Used: 790 On Hand: 6251 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS 1700




GASCO ® cascoenercy @

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE #40026 7096 K/7F Sop Y3-0Y7 346093
Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/03/06 |Days: 4
Depth: 6325' lProg: 1326' |D Hrs: 21 ]AV ROP: 63.1 Formation: Green River
DMC: $9,119  |TMC: $14,618 TDC: $33,284 [cwe: $783,045
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: F #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Bit #: 1 Conductor: 3 - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: R SPM: Size: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
lpvive: E #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm  [Type: DSX416 Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500
| Gel: S SPM: IMFG: HYC |Prod Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: H GPM : SIN: 113676 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: W Press: Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: 3 -
Solids: A AV DC: TD Out: ' TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
Sand: T AV DP: Depth In: 3626 Packers: 3 - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : E JetVel: IFTG: 2699 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
P/Mf: R |ecD: IHrs: 40.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 10000 JsPr#1: IFPH: 66.6 |Heater: $ - [Bits: $ -
Ca : 160  |sPrR#2: WOB: 10-20 IPumping ur: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2415
iDapp ppb: iBtm.Up: iR-RPM: 45 |Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [m-RPM: 65 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 900
START END TIME | 44.5 | Total Rot. Hrs: 40.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 9119
06:00 09:30 3:30 |Drilling 4999’ - 5141' (142' @ 40.2fph) Misc. / Labor: $ -
09:30 11:30 2:00 |WLS: 1@ 5057' ( Repair Survey Winch Took 1 Hour) Csg. Crew: $ -
11:30 02:30 15:00 |Drilling 5141' - 6129’ (988' @ 65.9fph) Daily Total: $ 33,284
02:30 03:30 1:.00 JWLS:21/2° @ 6129 Cum. Wir: $ 10,099
03:30 06:00 2:30 |Drilling 6129' - 6325' (196' @ 78.4fph) Cum. Fuel $ 20,882
Cum. Bits: $ 8,500
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
MM .16 35.45
IBS 4.54
SHOCK SUB 10.22
1DC 29.7
IBS 4.63
20 DC's 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 686.41
Survey 1° 5057
24.00 Survey 21/2° 6129'
P/U 155 K# LITH: 5% Sand 75% Shale & 20%Silt BKG GAS 185
S/0 145 K# FLARE: N/A CONN GAS 1087
ROT. 150 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 1087
FUEL Used: 1038  On Hand: 5253 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A




GASCGO ® cascoenercy @

5 DAILY DRILLING REPORT
nergy AFE#40026 7075 R [1F SR0 Y3-04p-36oss

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/04/06 ]Days: 5
Depth: 6325' lProg: 1409' [D Hrs: 23 IAV ROP: 61.3 Formation: Wasatch
DMC: $235 |Tmc: $14,853 TDC: $24,630 Jcwe: $783,045
‘ Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
| MW: 8.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit # 1 Conductor: 3 - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 27 SPM: 110 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
LPVIYP: 70 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: DSX416 jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gek: 3/2 SPM: IvFG: HYC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: GPM: 400 |sm: 113676 |Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: 3 -
Cake: JPress: 1450 |Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 1 AV DC: 340 hoout TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
Sand: AV DP: 207 fDepth In: 3530 |Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
fPH : 9.5 JetVel: 110 lFTG: 4108 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .8/6.8 |ecp: 8.6 lHrs: 63.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 10000 |sPR#1: IFPH: 64.7 |Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca: 160 JsPR#2: WOB: 156-22 IPumping ur: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 28645
|papp ppb: |Btm.Up: 30 |r-RPM: 45 IPrime Moverr $ -  |Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. jm-RPM: 65 IMisc: $ - |[consultant: $ 900
START END TIME | 44.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 63.5 |Daily Total: $ - |Dritling Mud: $ 235
06:00 16:30 10:30 |Drilling 6325' - 7022' ( 697' @ 66.4fph) Misc. / Labor: 3 -
16:30 17:30 1:00_|Rig Service Csg. Crew: $ -
17:30 06:00 12:30 |Drilling 7022’ - 7734' ( 712' @ 57.9fph) Daily Total: $ 24,630
Cum. Wtr: $ 1 0,099
Cum. Fuel $ 20,882
Cum. Bits: $ 8,500
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
MM .16 35.45
IBS 4.54
SHOCK SUB 10.22
1DC 29.7
IBS 4.63
20 DC's 600.87
i TOTAL BHA = 686.41
| Survey 10 5057'
24.00 Survey 21/2° 6129’
P/U 185 K# LITH: 10% Sand 80% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 159
S/I0 170 K# FLARE: N/A CONN GAS 1046
ROT. 177 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 1046
FUEL Used: 1167 On Hand: 4086 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A




GASCO

Energy

® Gascoenergy @

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE #40026 7 975 K/JE SR0 Y3-047-360%3

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/05/06 |Days: 6
Depth:  8550' |Prog:  815' |DHrs:  231/2 |AVROP: 347 |Formation: Wasatch
DMC: $784 |TMC: $15,637 TDC: $25,237 |CcwWC: $809,128
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: 8.8 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm  [Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: 3 -
VIS: 37 SPM: 110 Size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
A G N/C #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm ]Type: DSX416 jint. Csg: 3 - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: N/C SPM: MFG: HYC IProd Csg: $ - [Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: GPM : 400 JsIN: 113676 Float Equp: 3 - Trucking: 3 -
Cake: Press: 1490 |Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 1 AV DC: 340 [tpout TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuen $ -
Sand: AV DP: 207 |pepthin: 3530 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
jPH : 9.5 JetVel: 110 |frre: 5020 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfle: .8/6.8 ECD: 8.6 Hrs: 87 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 10000 |IsPr#1: 30 @ 200)eH: 57.7 [Heater: $ - |[sits: $ -
Ca : 160 |sPr#2: WOB: 15-22 IPumping LT $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,703
Jbapp ppb: Btm.Up: 30 |R-RPM: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [m-RPM: 65 Misc: $ - |Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 445 Total Rot. Hrs: 87.0 |paiy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 784
06:00 17:30 11:30 |Drilling 7734' - 8266' ( 532' @ 30.4fph) Misc. / Labor: $ -
17:30 18.00 0:30 |Rig Service - Function Test Pipe Rams & Annular BOP Csg. Crew: $ -
18:00 06:00 | 12:00 |Drilling 8266' - 8550' ( 284' @ 23.7fph) Daily Total: $ 25,237
Start Mud-Up @ 8300’ Cum. Wtr; $ 10,099
Cum. Fuel $ 20,882
Cum. Bits: $ 8,500
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
MM .16 35.45
IBS 4.54
SHOCK SUB 10.22
1DC 29.7
IBS 4.63
20 DC's 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 686.41
Survey 10 5057'
24.00 Survey 21/2° 6129'
P/U 195 K# LITH: 55% Sand 40% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 159
S/IO 185 Ki# FLARE: N/A CONN GAS 3395
ROT. 190 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 3395
FUEL Used: 1249 On Hand: 2837 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A




GASCO ® GASCOENERGY @

Tn DAILY DRILLING REPORT
crgy AFE #40026 7 075 H/J5 SRo 4Z-0yp 36003

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/06/06 IDays: 7
Depth:  8900' |Prog:  350' |DHrs: 23 |AVROP: 152 |Formation: Wasatch
DMC: $9,445 |TMC: $25,083 TDC: $55,179 jcwc: $888,991
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 8.8 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm  |Bit #: 1 Conductor: 3 - Loc,Cost; $ -
VIS: 36 SPM: 111 Size: 7718 Surf. Csg: 3 - Rig Move: $ -
[pvive: 7/11 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm | Type: DSX416 Jint. csg: $ -  |Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 4/8/11 |sPm: IMFaG: HYC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL 26 GPM : 385 JsiN: 113676 IFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: 3 -
Cake: 1/32  |Press: 1595 ets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 2 AV DC: 340 jtpout TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuel $ 21,339
Sand: TR AV DP: 207  pepth In: 3530 IPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
|pH : 9.5 JetVel: 110 |FTG: 5370 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfle: .8/6.8 |ecp: 8.6 IHrs: 110 Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chlor: 6000 |JsPr#1: 30@ 200IFPH: 48.8 JHeater: 3 - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 160 SPR #2 : WOB: 22-26 IPumping LT: 3 - Mud Motors: $ 2,645
Ipapp ppb: 5.2  |Btm.Up: 30 |r-RPM: 45 IPrime Mover: 3 - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 65 IMisc: 3 - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 45 Total Rot. Hrs: 110.0 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 9,445
06:00 06:30 0:30 |Drilling 8550' - 8557' ( 7' @ 14.0fph) Misc. / Labor: 3 -
06:30 07:00 0:30 JRig Repair - Pumps Csg. Crew: $ -
07:00 16:30 9:30 |Drilling 8557' - 8745' ( 188' @ 19.8fph) Daily Total: $ 55179
16:30 17:00 0:30 |Rig Service - Function Test Pipe Rams & Annular BOP Cum. Wtr: $ 10,099
17:00 06:00 | 13:00 |Drilling 8745' - 8900 ( 155' @ 12.0fph) Cum. Fuel $ 63,560
Cum. Bits: $ 8,500
BHA
BIT 1 1.00
MM .16 35.45
IBS 4.54
SHOCK SUB 10.22
1DC 29.7
IBS 4,63
20 DC's 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 686.41
Survey 1° 5057
24.00 Survey 21/2° 6129’
P/U 200 K# LITH: 40% Sand 55% Shale & 15%Silt BKG GAS 154
S/0 190 K# FLARE: N/A CONN GAS 1897
ROT. 195 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 1897
FUEL Used: 1148  On Hand: 9935 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A




GASCO ® Gcascoenercy @

Tror DAILY DRILLING REPORT
gy AFE #40026 7095 K /75 S0 Y zpyr 363

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Tripping 03/07/06 lDays: 8
Depth: 9035’ |Prog: 135' |DHrs: 12 IAV ROP: 11.3  |Formation: Wasatch
DMC: $2,231 ITMC: $27,314 TDC: $33,861 JCWC: $922,852
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-1 DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
fmw: 9 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 33 SPM: 111 Size: 77/8 7 7/8 Jsurf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: 3 -
|pvrve: 6/8 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm  |Type: DSX416 | HC506Z |int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 4/5/10 Jspm: MFG: HYC HTC IProd Csg: $ - Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 26 GPM : 385 |sm: 113676 | 7109256 IFIoat Equp: 3 - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/32  |Press: 1600 |Jets: 6X16 6 x 16s |Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 2.8 AV DC: 340 |mpout 9035 TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fue 3 -
Sand: TR AV DP: 207 |pepth in: 3530 9035 |Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
JPH : 9.0 JetVel: 110 IFTG: 5505 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfle: .8/6.8 |ecp: 8.6 IHrs: 122 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 6000 |[sPr#1: 50 @ 4OOIFPH: 45.1 |Heater: 3 - |Bits: $ 8500
Ca : 160 SPR #2: WOB: 22-28 IPumping LT: 3 - Mud Motors: $ 1,380
IDapp ppb: 52 |Btm.up: 41  Jr-RPM: 45 IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: 3 -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 65 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 45 Total Rot. Hrs: 122.0 lDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,231
06:00 18:00 12:00 |Drilling 8900 - 9035' ( 135' @ 11.25fph) Misc. / Labor: $ -
18:00 19:00 1:00 [Rig Service - Function Test Pipe Rams & Annular BOP Csg. Crew: $ -
19:00 20:00 1:00 |Mix & Pump Pill, Dropped Survey & Blow Kelly Dry Daily Total: $ 33,861
20:00 21:30 1:30 LD 15 Jts To Make Room In Hole f/ Hardband DP In Derrick Cum. Wir: $ 10,099
21:30 01:30 4:00 JTOOH - No Tight Spots Cum. Fuel $ 63,560
01:30 02:30 1:00 |LD Mud Motor - Function Blind Rams Cum. Bits: $ 17,000
02:30 03:00 0:30 |Pull & Inspect Wear Ring - Reran Same BHA # 2
03.00 04.00 1:00 |PU BHA # 2 - New Motor & Bit BIT 1 1.00
04.00 06.00 2:00 |Trip In Hole - Ran 5 Stands Hardband On Bottom MM .13 1 33.06
IBS 1 4.54
SHOCKSUH 1 10.22
1-61/4"DC| 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 684.02
Survey 21/2° 6129'
24.00 Survey 3 1/4° 9000'
P/U 205 K# LITH: 50% Sand 45% Shale & 5%Silt BKG GAS 108
SIO 193 K# FLARE: N/A CONN GAS 830
ROT. 198 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 830
FUEL Used: 1157 On Hand: 8778 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A




GASCO ENERGY @
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE #40026 7 p 73 RIIE SR0 YFv47- 36083

GASCO
Energy

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/08/06 |Days: 9
Depth: 9560 lProg: 525' |DHrs: 17 1/2 |AV ROP: 30.0 Formation: Mesaverde
DMC: $2,772  |T™C: $30,087 TDC: $27,250 |ewe: $949,469
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-! DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 42 SPM: 111 ]size: 77/8 7 7/8 Jsurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
lPvrvp: 8/7 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm  [Type: DSX416 | HC506Z hlnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 3/12/18 lspm: 110 |mFe: HYC HTC IProd Csg: 3 - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 20 GPM : 385 |sin: 113676 | 7109256 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/32  |Press: 1675 |vets: 6X16 6 X 165 |well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 2.4 |avpc: 343 JTDOut: 9035 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
Sand: TR AV DP: 208 |]pepth In: 3530 9035 |Packers: 3 - Mud Logger: $ 850
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 111 IFTG: 5505 525 Tanks: 3 - Logging: $ -
P/MF: .5/6.2 |ecp: 9.6 IHrs: 122 17.5  |Separator: 3 - |Cement: 3 -
Chlor: 6000 |sPr#1: 50 @ 450|FPH: 45.1 30.0 [Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca: 140 sPrR#2: 50 @ 400jwoB: 22-28 10-22  Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: 3 2,013
Ipapp ppb: 5.1 |Btm.Up: 42  |rR-RPM: 45 50 Jprime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |m-RPM: 65 50 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 48 Total Rot. Hrs: 139.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,772
06:00 07:00 1:00 |TIH Misc. / Labor: $ 715
07:00 10:00 3:00 |Rig Repair - Blocks Swivel Lock & Rotary Chain Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 12:00 2:00 |TIH - No Bridges Daily Total: $ 27,250
12:00 12:30 0:30 [Wash & Ream 60' To Bottom - No Fill Cum. Wtr: $ 10,099
12:30 06:00 17:30 |Drilling 9035' - 9560' ( 525' @ 30.0fph) Cum. Fuel $ 63,560
Cum. Bits: $ 17,000
Rig Inspection By BLM Rep; Randy Bywater BHA # 2
All Requirements Found To be In Order. BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 33.06
IBS 1 4.54
SHOCKSUR 1 10.22
1-61/4"DC{ 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
6 1/4" DC's 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 684.02
Survey 21/2° 6129'
24.00 Survey |31/4°| 9000
P/U 215 K# LITH: 35% Sand 50% Shale & 15%Silt BKG GAS 205
S/IO 195 K# FLARE: N/A CONN GAS 2200
ROT. 205 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 5267
FUEL Used: 1160 On Hand: 7618 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS 2900




GASCO ® Gascoenercy @

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE #40026 7095 R/IE S0 Y7049-360%7
Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/09/06 IDays: 10
Depth: 10055' |Prog: 495' |[D Hrs: 231/2 IAV ROP: 211 Formation: Mesaverde
DMC: $8,750  |TMC: $38,838 TDC: $35,237 lewe: $984,706
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit#: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 40 SPM: 111 Isize: 77/8 7 7/8 |suri. csg: 3 - Rig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 9/14 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm  [Type: DSX416 | HC506Z Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 11/24/31 |spm: 110 |vFG: HYC HTC  |Prod Csg: $ - |Rentals: 3 1,500
WL: 20 GPM : 385 |sin: 113676 | 7109256 {Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/32  [Press: 1750 |yets: 6X16 6 x 16s |well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,034
Solids: 3 AV DC: 343 |mDout: 9035 TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: TR AV DP: 208 |pepthin: 3530 9035 [pPackers: % - Mud Logger: $ 850
JpH : 9.5 JetVel: 111 FTG: 5505 1020 [Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
[P 6/6.4 |eco: 9.8 |urs: 122 41 lseparator:  $ - |coment $ ]
Chlor; 6000 |sPrR#1: 50 @ 500|FPH: 451 24.9  [Heater: $ - [Bits: $ -
Ca : 160 sPR#2: 50 @ 550jwos: 22-28 18-24 |Pumping LT 3 - Mud Motors: $ 2,703
IDapp ppb: 5.2  |Btm.up: 46  |r-RPM: 45 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 65 50 |Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 48 Total Rot. Hrs: 162.5 IDain Total: $ - |prilling Mud: $ 8750
06:00 | 17:30 | 11:30 |Drilling 9560' - 9792' ( 232' @ 20.2fph) Misc. / Labor:
17:30 18:00 0:30 |Rig Service Csg. Crew: 3 -
18:00 06:00 12:00 |Drilling 9792' - 10055' { 263' @ 22.0fph) Daily Total: $ 35237
Cum. Wtr: $ 12,133
Cum. Fuel $ 63,560
Cum. Bits: $ 17,000
BHA # 2
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 33.06
IBS 1 4.54
BOP Dirills Conducted By Both Tours SHOCKSUH 1 10.22
1-61/4"DC| 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 684.02
Survey 21/2° 6129'
24.00 Survey 3 1/4° 9000’
P/U 220 K# LITH: 25% Sand 60% Shale & 15%Silt BKG GAS 215
S/I0 200 K# FLARE: N/A CONN GAS 1000
ROT. 210 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 5180
FUEL Used: 1327  On Hand: 6291 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A




GASCO ® GcascoenNercy @

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE#40026 7075 A)fs SRo 43049364,
Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/10/06 |Days: 11
Depth: 10461 |Prog: 406' |[D Hrs: 231/2 IAV ROP: 17.3 Formation: Mesaverde
DMC: $2,054 ITMC: $40,893 TDC; $27,067 Jcwc: $1,011,773
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 9.6 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm  |Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 SPM: Size: 7718 7 7/8 [surt. Csg: 3 - Rig Move: $ -
PV/IYP: 9/15 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: DSX416 | HC506Z |int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 12/35/41 |spm: 110 |wFG: HYC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 20 GPM : 385 |siN: 113676 | 7109256 |Float Equp: $ - [Trucking: 3 -
Cake: 1/32  [Press: 1722 |Jets: 6X16 6 x 16s |well Head: $ - |water: 3 -
Solids: 3.4 AV DC: 343 |rpout 9035 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: TR AV DP: 208 [pepthIn: 3530 9035 [Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
|pH - 9.0 JetvVel: 111 |FTG: 5505 1426  |ranks: $ - |togging: $ -
IPfIMf: 6/6.0 [ecp: 9.8 IHrs: 122 64.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 6000 {spr#1: 50 @ 560]FPH: 451 22.1  |Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca: 160 |[sPr#2: 50 @ 520}woB: 22-28 18-24 lPumping uT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,703
|Dapp ppb: 5.2 |Bmm.Up: 48 |rrPM: 45 50 IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [w-rPm: 65 50 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 48 Total Rot. Hrs: 186.0 lDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,054
06:00 10:30 4:30 |Drilling 10055' - 10143' { 88'@ 19.6fph) Misc. / Labor: 3 560
10:30 1100 0:30 [Rig Service - Function Test BOP Csg. Crew: 3 -
11:00 06:00 | 19:00 §Drilling 10143' - 10461' ( 318' @ 16.7fph) Daily Total: $ 27,067
Cum. Wir: $ 12,133
Cum. Fuel $ 63,560
Cum. Bits: $ 17,000
BHA # 2
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 33.06
IBS 1 4.54
SHOCKSUH 1 10.22
1-61/4"DC| 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DCs | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 684.02
Survey |21/2°| 6129
24.00 Survey 31/4° 9000'
P/U 230 K# - LITH: 65% Sand 20% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 600
S/IO0 205 K# FLARE: N/A CONN GAS 2500
ROT. 218 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 3574
FUEL Used: 1377 On Hand: 4914 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A

v



GASGCO ® GcaAscoENErRGY @

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE #40026 7095 g )9f G20 Y3040 Fhots
Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Tripping 03/111/06 |Days: 12
Depth: 10678 |Prog: 217" |DHrs: 16 |AV ROP: 13.6 Formation: Mesaverde
DMC: $5107  |TmcC: $46,000 TDC: $49,431 |cwe: $1,061,204
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Imw: 9.9 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm  [Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS 40 SPM: Size: 77/8 7 7/8 |surf. Csg: $ - [RigMove: $ -
PV/IYP: 11/15 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm  |Type: DSX416 | HC506Z [int. Csg: 3 - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 9/31/43 |sPm: 110 |wFG: HYC HTC |Prod Csg: $ - Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 14 GPM : 385 |sin: 113676 | 7109256 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/32  |Press: 1800 |ets: 6X16 6 x 16s |Well Head: $ - [water: 3 -
Solids: 3.6 AV DC: 343 |DOut: 9035 10678 |1BG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel $ 20,734
Sand: TR AV DP: 208 |pepth In: 3530 9035 |Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
|PH : 9.0 JetVel: 111 IFTG: 5505 1643 |ITanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfle: .5/6.5 |ecp: 10.2 IHrs: 122 80.5 [separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 5000 |JsPR#1: 50 @ SOOIFPH: 45.1 22.1  [Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 160 [JsPrR#2: 50 @ 500jwoB: 22-28 18-24 IPumping LT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 1,840
IDapp ppb: 4.8  [IBtm.up: 51 R-RPM: 45 40-55 IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 65 50 Misc: 3 - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 48.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 202.0 [paily Total: $ - |Dritling Mud: $ 5107
06:00 14:30 8:30 |Drilling 10461' - 10589' ( 128' @ 15.1fph) Misc. / Labor: $ -
14:30 15:00 0:30 [Rig Service - Function Test BOP Csg. Crew: $ -
15:00 22:30 7:30 Drilling 10589' - 10678' ( 86' @ 11.9fph) Daily Total: $ 49,431
22:30 23:30 1:00 |Circ & Cond - Mix Weight Pill Cum. Wtr: $ 12,133
23:30 00:00 0:30 JPump Pill - Blow Down Kelly - Dropped Survey Cum. Fuel $ 84294
00:00 01:00 1:00 |LD 15 Jts Slick DP To Put 5 Stands Hardband On Bottom Cum. Bits: $ 17,000
01:00 05:00 4:00 JTOOH - No Tight Spots BHA#2
05:00 05:30 0:30 |Rig Repair Block Swivel BIT 1 1.00
05:30 06:00 0:30 |TOOH MM .13 1 33.06
IBS 1 4.54
SHOCKSUE 1 10.22
1-61/4"DC| 1 29.70
IBS 1 463
61/4"DCs | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 684.02
Survey 2 1/2° 6129’
24.00 Survey 3 1/4° 9000'
P/U 240 K# LITH: 70% Sand 20% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 1600
S/0 205 Ki# FLARE: 5'-10' CONN GAS 5000
ROT. 221 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 10600
FUEL Used: 1880 On Hand: 109870 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A




GASCO

Energy

GASCOENERGY ®
DAILY DRILLING REPORT '

AFE # 40026 7 095

RIIE S—w YF0Y2-Fpods

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/12/06 |Days: 13
Depth: 10827’ lProg: 149' |D Hrs: 13 |AV ROP: 11.5 Formation: Lower Mesaverde
DMC: $765 ITMC: $46,765 TDC: $34,794 |cwc: $1,094,503
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.1 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit #: 2 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: 3 -
VIS: 45 SPM: Size: 77/8 7 7/8 |surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
Ievivp: 15/16 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: HC506Z | MF45H |int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 8/27/35 |[spm: 110 |™FG: HTC STC  |prod Csg: $ - |Rentals: 3 1,500
WL: 12 GPM : 385 (sIN: 7109256 | PB0826 [Fioat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/32  |Press: 1800 |Jets: 6 X 168) 2-24.1-22 Jwell Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 3.6 AV DC: 343 |mout 10678 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
Sand: TR AV DP: 208 [pepthIn: 9035 10678 [Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH : 9.0 JetVel: 111 IFTG: 1643 149 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Pf/Mf: .2/5.7 [ecp: 10.2 lHrs: 80.5 13 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 5000 |sPr#1: 50 @ 500|FPH: 22.1 11.5 |Heater: $ - Bits: $ 9,500
Ca: 120 IsPR#2: 50 @ 500}wos: 18-24 35-42  |pumping LT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 1,495
|papp ppb: 4.9 iBtm.Up: 51 R-RPM: 40-55 40-50 iPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 50 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 50.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 215.0 [Daily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 765
06:00 06:30 0:30 |JTOOH - Dropped Survey 2 3/4° @ 10678 Misc. / Labor: $ 1,284
06:30 08:00 1:30 [Change Out Bit & MM - Replace Wear Bushing Csg. Crew: 3 -
08:00 10:30 2:30 |TIH To Shoe Daily Total: $ 34,794
10:30 11:30 1:00 |Slip & Cut Drill Line Cum. Wtr: $ 12,133
11:30 13:30 2:00 Rig Repair - Block Hook Llocking Assembly Cum. Fuel $ 84,294
13:30 16:30 3:00 }Finish TIH -No Bridges Cum. Bits: $ 26,500
16:30 17:00 0:30 |Wash 60' To Bottom - No Fill BHA #3
17:00 06:00 13:00 |Drilling 10678' -10827' ( 149" @ 11.5fph) BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 32.93
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC| 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.67
Survey 31/4° 9000
24.00 Survey 2 3/4° 10678
P/U 240 K# LITH: 80% Sand 15% Shale & 15%Silt BKG GAS 450
S/IO 205 K# FLARE: 5'-10' CONN GAS 2050
ROT. 224 Kt LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 1566
FUEL Used: 1318 On Hand: 9669 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS 1119




GASCO

Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40026 7" 0 75

KBIE S0 4 F~090-F6083

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/13/06 |Days: 14
Depth: 11006 |Pr@i 179' |DHrs: 23 |AV ROP: 7.8 Formation: Lower Mesaverde
DMC: $2,912 ITMC: $49,678 TDC: $27,307 |JCWC: $1,121,810
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 99 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit #: 2 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 42 SPM: 111 |size: 778 7 7/8 ]surf. Csg: 3 - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 13/17 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: HC5062 MF45H |int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 18,500
Gel: 11/35/42 |sPm: 110 |vFG: HTC STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 13.2 GPM : 385 |sIN: 7109256 | PB0826 |F|oat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1132 Press: 1850 ets: 6 x 16s | 2-24,1-22 well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 36 lavpc: 343 |t Out: 10678 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuen $ -
Sand: TR AV DP: 208 |pepth In: 9035 10678 [Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
|PH : 9.0 JetVel: 111 |FTG: 1643 328  |Tanks: 3 - |Logging: $ -
PfIMf: .5/6.5 [EcD: 10 IHrs: 80.5 36 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior: 5000 |IsPr#1: 50 @ 540|FPH: 221 9.1 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 [spr#2: 50 @ 520jwoB: 18-24 35-42 IPumping ut: % - |Mud Motors: $ 2645
Dapp ppb: 51 iBtm.Up: 52 R-RPM: 40-55 40-50 IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 50 50 IMisc: 3 - |consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 50.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 238.0 IDain Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $ 2912
06:00 08:30 2:30 |Drilling 10827' - 10848' (21' @ 8.4fph) Misc. / Labor: $ -
08:30 09:00 0:30 ]Change Out Saver Sub Csg. Crew: $ -
09:00 17:30 8:30 |Drilling 10848' - 10928' ( 80" @ 9.4fph) Daily Total: $ 27,307
17:30 18:00 0:30 |Rig Service Cum. Wir: $ 12,133
18.00 06:00 12:00 |Drilling 10928' - 11006' ( 78' @ 6.5fph) Cum. Fuel $ 84294
Cum. Bits: $ 26,500
BHA #3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 32.93
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC| 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.67
Survey 31/4° 9000’
24.00 Survey 2 3/4° 10678'
P/U 250 K# LITH: 65% Sand 20% Shale & 15%Silt BKG GAS 1650
S/I0 205 K# FLARE: 5'-8 CONN GAS 2300
ROT. 226 Ki# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 2937
FUEL Used: 1516  On Hand: 8153 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A




GASCO

Energy

GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
AFE #40026 7 095 p /7F SRo 93Fo7r =6o

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Drilling 03/14/06 |Days: 15
Depth: 11006' IPrg% 130" |DHrs: 22 1/2 |AV ROP: 5.8 Formation: Lower Mesaverde
DMC: $1,701 ITMC: $51,380 TDC: $27,484 |CWC: $1,104,506
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Bit #: 2 3 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 41 SPM: 111 [size: 77/8 7 7/8 |surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 12/19 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Type: HC506Z | MF45H [int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 11/35/42 |sPm: 110 [wFG: HTC STC |prodcsg: $ - Rentals: $ 1,500
WL 12.4  |epPm: 385 |siN: 7109256 | PB0826 |Float Equp: $ - iTrucking: $ 945
Cake: 1/32 Press: 1850 JJets: 6 x 16s |2-24,1-22 |well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 4 AV DC: 343 [moout 10678 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
Sand: TR AV DP: 208 |Depthin: 9035 10678 |Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
lpH : 9.0 JetVel: 111 IFTG: 1643 328 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Pf/Mf: 4/6.0 |Jecp: 10 |Hrs: 80.5 58.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 5000 |sPr#1: 50@ 540|FPH: 221 9.1 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca: 120 sPR#2: 50 @ 520]woB: 18-24 35-42 |Pumping LT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,588
Dapp ppb: 51 |Btm.Up: 52  |r-RPM: 40-55 40-50 [Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 50 50 IMisc: $ - |[Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 260.5 IDain Total: $ - |orilling Mud: $ 1,701
06:00 01:30 19:30 |Drilling 11006' - 11120'( 114' @ 5.9fph) Misc. / Labor: $ -
01:30 03.00 1:30 |Rig Repair - Pumps Csg. Crew: $ -
03:00 06:00 3:00 |Drilling 11120'-11136' ( 16' @ 5.3fph) Daily Total: $ 27,484
Cum. Wtr: $ 12,133
Cum. Fuel $ 84,294
Cum. Bits: $ 26,500
BHA # 3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 32.93
IBS 1 454
1-61/4"DC| 1 29.70
IBS 1 463
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.67
Survey 31/4° 9000’
24.00 Survey 2 3/4° 10678’
P/U 245 Ki# LITH: 70% Sand 20% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 2100
S/IO 210 K# FLARE: 16-20' CONN GAS 2900
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 858" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 5019
FUEL Used: 1687 On Hand: 6466 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A




GASCO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40026 7 £95 R/ %~ S-Jp Y5-047- 36722
Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: Tripping 03/15/06 Days: 16
Depth: 11227' IProL 91' |DHrs: 201/2 IAV ROP: 4.5 Formation: Lower Mesaverde
DMC: $1,701 ITMC: $51,380 TDC: $28,669 |CWC: $1,133,232
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.2 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #*: 2 3 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 41 SPM: 111 |size: 77/8 7 7/8 |surf. Csg: 3 Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 13/18 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: HC506Z MF45H lint. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 9/33/41 |sPm: 110 wmFG: HTC STC IProd Csg: $ Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 12 GPM: 385 |sm: 7109256 | PB0826 IFIoat Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/32  |Press: 1850 |ets: 6 x 16s |2-24,1-22 |Well Head: $ Water: $ 2,360
Solids: 10 AV DC: 343 [moout: 10678 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
Sand: TR AV DP: 208 |DepthIn: 9035 10678 [Packers: $ Mud Logger: $ 850
IpH : 9.0  Jetvel: 108 IFTG: 1643 549  |ranks: $ Logging: $ -
Pf/Mf: 4/6.2 |eco: 10.6 IHrs: 80.5 79 Separator: $ Cement: $ -
Chlor: 5000 |spr#1: 50 @ 540|FPH: 221 6.9 Heater: $ Bits: $ -
Ca : 140 fspr#2: 50 @ 520]woB: 18-24 35-42 IPumping uT: 3 Mud Motors: $ 2,358
Dapp ppb: 51 Btm.Up: 53 |R-RPM: 40-55 40-50 lPrime Mover: $ Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 50 50 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 282.0 IDaily Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ 1,701
06:00 09:30 3:30 |Drilling 11136' - 11151' ( 15' @ 4.2fph) Misc. / Labor: 3 -
09:30 10:00 0:30 [Rig Service Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 03:00 | 17:00 |Drilling 11151' - 11227' ( 76' @ 4.5fph) Daily Total: $ 28,669
03:00 04.00 1:00 |Mix & Pump Pill - Drop Survey - Blow Down Kelley Cum. Witr: $ 14,493
04:00 04:30 0:30 LD 6 - Jts To Allow f/ Remaining Hardband To Be On Bottom Cum. Fuel $ 84,204
04:30 06:00 1:30 |TOOH Cum. Bits: $ 26,500
BHA # 3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 32.93
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC| 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.67
Survey 31/4° 9000'
24.00 Survey 2 3/4° 10678’
P/IU 240 K# LITH: 50% Sand 30% Shale & 20%Silt BKG GAS 3100
S/IO 210 K# FLARE: 12'-16' CONN GAS 5100
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 6054
FUEL Used: 1678 On Hand: 4788 Co.Man Chuck Emerson TRIP GAS N/A




GASGO

Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40026 7 »9S

0] 75 S=P0 Y3-0502 3402

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/16/06 |Days: 17
Depth: 11290’ IPI"OQZ 63" |DHrs: 12 1/2 |Av ROP: 5.0 Formation: Lower Mesaverde
DMC: $3.356  |TMC: $54,736 TDC: $37,904 |cwe: $1,171,136
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-l DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.2 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm lBit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 41 SPM: 111 |Size: 778 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 13/18 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm | Type: MF45H Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Ge: 0/33/41 |spm: 108 |wre: STC [proacss:  $ - |Rentas: $ 1,500
wL: 12 GPM : 398 JsiN: PC6930 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/32  |Press: 1791 Jets: 3X24 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 2,360
Solids: 10 AV DC: 334 {moout: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuen $ -
Sand: TR AV DP: 203 |pepthin: 11227 fPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 108 IFTG: 63 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Pf/Mf: .4/6.2 [eco: 10.9 |Hrs: 12.5 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 5000 |sPr#1: 50 @ 540]eh: 5.0 {Heater: $ - |sits: $ 8500
Ca : 140 |sPr#2: 50 @ 520]woB: 15/30 IPumping LT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,438
Dapp ppb: 5.1 Btm.Up: 53 R-RPM: 40-50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 50 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 2945 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 3,356
06:00 10:00 4:00 |TOOH (NO TIGHT HOLE) Misc. / Labor: $ -
10:00 12:00 2:00 |R/R MUD MOTOR AND BIT SURVEY 2 1/4° @ 11227 Csg. Crew: $ -
12:00 17:00 5:00 [TIH Daily Total: $ 37,904
17:00 17:30 0:30 JWASH AND REAM 60' (NO FILL) Cum. Wtr: $ 14,493
17:30 06:00 12:30 |DRLG 11227' - 11290' (63' @ 5 FPH) Cum. Fuel $ 84,294
Cum. Bits: $ 35,000
BHA#3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 32.90
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.64
Survey 2 3/4° 10678'
24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 11227
P/U 250 K# LITH: 40% Sand 30% Shale & 30%Silt BKG GAS 2040
S/O 210 K# FLARE: 30' CONN GAS 2600
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 3091
FUEL Used: 1649  On Hand: 3139 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS 3091




GASCO ENERGY
G A S C O DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Energy

AFE # 40026y 93 f/75 S—i0 Y3-0%- 3605

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/17/06 |Days: 18
Depth: 11453’ lPro : 163' [DHrs: 231/2 |AV ROP: 6.9 Formation: Lower Mesaverde
DMC: $1,5632 TMC: $56,268 TDC: $47,324 |CWC: $1,216,099
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
jmw: 10.2 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm  [Bit#: 4 Conductor: 3 - Loc,Cost: 3 -
VIS: 40 SPM: 109 |[size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 13/18 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm | Type: MF45H Jint. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 11/35/44 |spm: IMFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 12.8 JGPM: 402 |siN: PC6930 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/32  |Press: 2010 |Jets: 3X24 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 11 AV DC: 337 |mpout: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuen $ 20,734
Sand: AV DP: 205 iDepth In: 11227 IPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
| G 9.0 Jetvel: 97 FTG: 226" Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
I;fle: .2/5.6 |ecD: 10.6 |Hrs: 36 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chilor: 5000 |sPrR#1: 50 @ 540)FPH: 6.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 160 sPR#2: 50 @ 520jwoB: 30/40 Pumping L/T: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,703
Dapp ppb: 49 IBtm.Up: 53 R-RPM: 50 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 318.0 |paily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,632
06:00 12:30 6:30 |DRLG 11290 - 11333' (43 @6.6 Misc. / Labor: $ 106
12:30 13:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
13:00 06:00 17:00 |DRLG 11333 - 11453 (120 @ 7.0 Daily Total: $ 47,324
Cum. Witr: $ 14,493
Cum. Fuel $ 1 05,028
Cum. Bits: $ 35,000
BHA#3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 32.90
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4'DCs | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.64
Survey 2 3/4° 10678’
24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 11227
P/U 250 K# LITH: 50% Sand 30% Shale & 20%Siit BKG GAS 1200
S/O 210 K# FLARE: 2§ CONN GAS 1750
ROT. 230 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 3252
FUEL Used: 1724  On Hand: 9180 Co.Man Scott Alired TRIP GAS




GASCO ENERGY
G A S C O DAILY DRILLING REPORT
Energy

AFE # 40026 7/ 095 K7L Szie 4 F047- 36293

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/18/06 |Days: 19
Depth: 11569' IProgL 116" [D Hrs: 24 lAV ROP: 4.8 Formation: Lower Mesaverde
DMC: $2,771 |™c: $59,039 TDC: $48,620 Jowe: $1,264,719
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Jmw: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 4 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 SPM: 113  [size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: MF45H Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 13/39/48 |spm: |vFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 14 GPM : 416 ISIN: PC6930 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ JPress: 2010 ets: 3X24 Well Head: 3 - Water: $ -
Solids: 12 AV DC: 349 |tDOut: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet: $ 20,734
Sand: AV DP: 212 |oepthIn: 11227 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
JpH : 9.0 Jetvel: 101 IFTG: 342’ Tanks: $ - Logging: 3 -
IPfIMf: .2/5.6 |Eeco: 10.78 IHrs: 60 Separator: 3 - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 5000 |spr#1: 50 @ 540|FPH: 5.7 iHeater: $ - |[Bits: 3 -
Ca : 160 |sPR#2: 50 @ 520]woB: 30/40 IPumping uT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,760
Dapp ppb: 48 |[Btm.Up: 53 |R-RPM: 50 IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 50 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 342.0 lDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,771
06:00 06:00 0:00 |DRLG 11453 - 1156' (116'@ 4.8 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 105
06:00 Csg. Crew: $ -
0 Daily Total: $ 48,620
Cum. Wtr: $ 14,493
Cum. Fuel $ 125,762
Cum. Bits: $ 35,000
BHA#3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 32.90
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DCl 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.64
Survey 2 3/4° 10678'
24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 11227
P/U 250 K# LITH: 60% Sand 30% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 800
S/IO0 225 Ki# FLARE: 25' CONN GAS 1350
ROT. 235 Ki# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 2288
FUEL Used: 1651 On Hand: 7529 Co.Man Scott Alired TRIP GAS




GASGO
Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40026 7 575

095 S0 9 3-04p-36073

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/19/06 |Days: 20
Depth: 11590 |Prog: 21" |DHrs: 7 |AV ROP: 3.0 Formation: Lower Mesaverde
DMC: $3,733 |TMC: $64,933 TDC: $56,127 JCWC: $1,320,846
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
fmw: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: 113 |size: 77/8 7 7/18 |surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 16/19 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: MF45H | K503BPX |int. Csg: 3 - |Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 13/38/49 JsPm: MFG: STC STC lProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 13.2 |ePm: 416 |IsIN: PC6930 | JW5397 |Float Equp: 3 - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ JPress: 2010 Juets: 3X24 1.2 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 12 AV DC: 349 1D oOut: 11582 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ 20,734
Sand: AV DP: 212 [Depth In: 11227 11582 [Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
JPH : 9.0 JetVel: 101 |FTG: 355 7 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .215.7 [eco: 10.78 IHrs: 63 3 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4000 |[spr#1: 50 @ﬁOIFPH: 5.6 2.3 Heater: $ - Bits: $ 8,500
Ca : 160 |sPR#2: 50 @ 520jwoB: 30/40 10/20 |Pumping LUT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 805
Dapp ppb: 4.9 |Btm.Up: 53 |r-RPM: 50 60 IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 50 350 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 349.0 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 3,733
06:00 10:00 4:00 |DRLG 11569 - 11582' (13'@ 3.2FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 105
10:00 18:00 8:00 |TOOH R/R MOTOR AND BIT SURVEY @ 1151 2 1/4° Csg. Crew: $ -
18:00 22:00 4:00 |TIH Daily Total: $ 56,127
22:00 22:30 0:30 |FILL PIPE Cum. Wtr: $ 14,493
22:30 01:00 2:30 |TIH Cum. Fuel $ 146,496
01:00 03:00 2:00 [WASH 90' TO BOTTOM Cum. Bits: $ 43,500
03:00 06:00 3:00 |DRLG 11583 - 11590' (7@ 2.3 FPH) BHA#3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 32.23
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 672.97
Survey 21/4° 11227
24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 1151
P/U 250 K# LITH: 60% Sand 30% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 800
S/I0 225 K# FLARE: 25 CONN GAS 1350
ROT. 235 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 8§5/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 2288
FUEL Used: 1587 On Hand: 5942 Co.Man Scott Alired TRIP GAS




GASGO

Energy

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE # 40026 7095 A/IE S-A9 Y3040 368z

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/20/06 |Days: 21
Depth: 11712 IProg: 122' |D Hrs: 23 |AV ROP: 5.3 Formation: Lower Mesaverde
DMC: $1,199 |TMC: $66,132 TDC: $46,933 JCWC: $1,367,779
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
Mw: 10.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm [ic #: 5 Conductor: $ - [Loc,Cost: 3 -
ViS: 45 SPM: 113  |size: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 15/22 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm | Type: K503BPX Jint. csg: $ -  |payRate: $ 19,000
Gel: 14/43/56 |sPMm: IMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - Rentals: $ 1,500
WL 132 lopm: 416 |sm: JW5397 [Froatequp:  $ - [rrucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ IPress: 2050 |Jets: 1.2 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 13 AV DC: 349 [tDoOut: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ 20,734
Sand: AV DP: 212  |pepth in: 11582 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
JeH : 9.0 JetVel: 113 IFTG: 130" Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
“’f/Mf: .2/5.9 [ecp: 10.93 lHrs: 26 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4000 |IsPr#1: 50 @ 540|FPH: 5.0 |Heater: $ - [sits: $ -
ca : 160 |spr#2: 50 @ 520]wos: 10/20 [pumpingr: 3 - |Mud Motors: $ 2645
|Dapp ppb: 5 |Btm.Up: 53 |R-RPM: 60 |Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [w-RPM: 350 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 372.0 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,199
06.00 07:00 1:00 [DRLG 11590 - 11597' (7' @ 4.6 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 105
07:00 08:00 1:00 |WORK ON PASON DEPTH SENSOR Csg. Crew: $ -
08.00 14:00 6:00 |DRLG 11597 - 11627' (30'@ 5.0FPH) Daily Total: $ 46,933
14:00 14:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Cum. Wtr: $ 14,493
14:30 06:00 15:30 |DRLG 11627 - 11712' (85' @ 5.6 FPH) Cum. Fuel $ 167,230
Cum. Bits: $ 43,500
BHA#3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 32.23
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC 1 29.70
IBS 1 463
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 672.97
Survey 21/4° 11227
24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 1151
P/U 250 Ki# LITH: 75% Sand 15% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 400
S/0 225 Ki# FLARE: 25 CONN GAS 670
ROT. 235 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 1249
FUEL Used: 2178 On Hand: 3764 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT

AFE #40026 7 095 K/9F6 S-s0 Y3042 36073

GASGO
Energy

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/21/06 Days: 22
Depth: 11832 |Prog: _ 120' |DHrs: 23 1/2 |av ROP: 51  |Formation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $2,630 |TMC: 368,762 TDC: $49,814 |CWC: $1,400,757
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 44 SPM: 113 |size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 15/18 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: K503BPX ilnt. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 13/38/45 |sPm: IvrG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 12.8 |ePm: 416 |siN: JW5397 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 859
Cake: 1/ IPress: 2050 JJets: 1.2 Well Head: $ - Water: $ 532
Solids: 12.4 |avpc: 349 hoout TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ 20,735
Sand: AV DP: 212 [pepthin: 11582 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
lpH - 9.0 JetVel: 113 IFTG: 250' Tanks: $ - |Logging: 3 -
IPfle: .2/5.5 |Jeco: 10.74 IHrs: 49 1/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |sPr#1: 50 @ 540IFPH: 5.1 |Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 160 SPR#2: 50 @ 520jwoB: 10/20 IPumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,703
IDapp ppb: 49 ]8tm.Up: 53 R-RPM: 60 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 350 Misc: 3 - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 395.5 |paily Total: $ - {Drilling Mud: $ 2,630
06:00 18:30 12:30 |DRLG 11712 - 11790' (78'@ 6.2FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 105
18:30 19.00 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: 3 -
19:00 06:00 11:00 |DRLG 11790 - 11832' (42'@ 3.8 FPH) Daily Total: $ 49,814
Cum. Wtr: $ 15,025
Cum. Fuel $ 171,129
Cum. Bits: $ 43,500
BHA #3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 32.23
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DCl 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4'DCs | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 672.97
Survey 2 1/4° 11227
24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 1151
P/U 250 Ki# LITH: 80% Sand 10% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 1400
S/IO 225 Ki#t FLARE: 2§ CONN GAS 1950
ROT. 235 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 2033
FUEL Used: On Hand: 11160 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/22/06 |Days: 23
Depth: 11905’ [Prog: 73 |DHrs: 24 |AVROP: 30 |Formation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $3,199  |TMC: $71,961 TDC: $35,992 |cwe: $1,436,749
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-1 DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 SPM: 113  [size: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: K503BPX Int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 13/38/45 |sPm: IvFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 14 GPM : 416 |siN: JW5397 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ Press: 2000 |Jyets: 1.2 Well Head: $ 254 |water: $ 7,424
Solids: 12 AV DC: 343 [tDoOut: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet $ -
Sand: AV DP: 208 [Depthin: 11582 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: 3 850
IpH : 9.0 JetVel: 111 IFTG: 323 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Pf/Mf: .2/5.9 [ecp: 10.88 IHrs: 731/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4000 |spr#1: 50 @ 540]FPH: 4.4 iHeater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca: 140 |spr#2: 50 @ 520jwoB: 10/20 IPumping ut: % - |Mud Motors: $ 2,760
Dapp ppb: 5 |Btm.Up: 55 R-RPM: 60 IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 350 IMisc: $ - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 419.5 IDain Total: $ 254 |Drilling Mud: $ 3,199
06.00 06:00 0:00 IDRLG 11832 - 11905' (73'@ 3'FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 106
06:00 Csg. Crew: $ -
0 Daily Total: $ 35,992
Cum. Wtr: $ 22,449
Cum. Fuel $ 171,129
Cum. Bits: $ 43,500
BHA#3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .90 1 32.23
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC| 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
|6 1/4" DC's 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 672.97
Survey 21/4° 11227
24.00 Survey 21/4° 1151
P/IU 250 Ki# LITH: 80% Sand 10% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 1375
SI0 225 Ki# FLARE: 25 CONN GAS 1900
ROT. 235 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 2530
FUEL Used: 2203  On Hand: 8957 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/23/06 |Days: 24
Depth: 11982 |Prog: _ 77' |DHrs: 23 1/2 |AVROP: 3.3 |Formation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $1,689 [TMC: $73,650 TDC: $26,947 JCWC: $1,463,695
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 10 SPM: 113 |size: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/IYP: 13/19 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Type: K503BPX Jint. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 14/35/45 [sPm: Ivra: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: 3 1,500
WL: 14 GPM : 409 |sIN: JW5397 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 200
Cake: 1/ Jpress: 2091  Juets: 1.2 Well Head: 3 - |water: 3 -
Solids: 12 AV DC: 343 |tDoOut: TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuen $ -
Sand: AV DP: 208 [pepth in: 11582 |packers: 3 - Mud Logger: $ 850
fpH : 9.0 JetVel: 111 IFTG: 400 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Ef/Mf: .2/5.8 {EcD: 10.75 IHrs: 97 Separator: 3 - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |[sPr#1: 50 @ 540IFPH: 4.1 Heater: $ - |Bits: 3 -
Ca : 160 |spr#2: 50 @ 520[woB: 10/20 Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,703
Dapp ppb: 4.9 |Btm.up: 55 |R-RPM: 60 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [mRPM: 350 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 443.0 |Dai|y Total: $ - |Drilting Mud: $ 1,689
06:00 10:30 4:30 |DRLG 11905 - 11914' (9@ 2'FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 105
10:30 11:00 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: 3 -
11:00 06:00 19:00 |DRLG 11914 - 11982' (68'@ 3.5'FPH) Daily Total: $ 26,947
Cum. Wtr: $ 22,449
Cum. Fuel $ 171 ,129
Cum. Bits: $ 43,500
BHA#3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .90 1 32.23
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DCl 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DCs | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 672.97
Survey 2 1/4° 11227
24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 1151
P/U 255 K# LITH: 85% Sand 10% Shale & 5%Silt BKG GAS 1400
S/IO 230 K# FLARE: 20 CONN GAS 1650
ROT. 240 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 2503
FUEL Used: 2094 On Hand: 6863 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/24/06 |Days: 25
Depth: 12066 |Prog:  84' |DHrs: 23 |AVROP: 3.7  |Formation: CASTLEGATE
DMC: $2,756 |TMC: $76,406 TDC: $27,956 |CWC: $1,491,651
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
[mw: 10.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 SPM: 113 Size: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 14/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Type: K503BPX Int. Csg: 3 - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Get: 13/39/49 |spm: wre: STC Prod Csg: $ - [Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 12.4 GPM : 409 SIN: JW5397 IFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 200
Cake: 1/ IPress: 2091 Juets: 1.2 Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 12.8  Javoc: 343 |oout: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuetk $ -
Sand: AV DP: 208 [pepth In: 11582 JPackers: 3 - Mud Logger: $ 850
iPH : 9.0 JetVel: 111 |FTG: 484 Tanks: 3 - |Logging: $ -
IPf/Mf: .26 ECD: 10.88 IHrs: 120 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 fsPr#1: 50 @ 540]FpH: 4.0 |Heater: $ - Isits: $ -
Ca : 140 SPR#2: 50 @ 520jwoB: 10/20 IPumping uT: 3 - Mud Motors: $ 2,645
IDapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 56  |rR-RPM: 60 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: 350 IMisc: 3 - Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 466.0 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,756
06:00 12:30 6:30 |DRLG 11982 - 12010' (28'@ 4.1' FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 105
12:30 13:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
13:00 19:00 6:00 IDRLG 12010 - 12042' (32’@ 5.3'FPH) Daily Total: $ 27,956
19:00 19:30 0:30 JCHANGE OUT ROTATING RUBBER Cum. Wtr: $ 22449
19:30 06:00 10:30 |IDRLG 12042 - 12066' (24'@ 2.3' FPH) Cum. Fuel $ 171,129
Cum. Bits: $ 43,500
BHA # 3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .90 1 32.23
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4'DCl 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 672.97
Survey 2 1/4° 11227
24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 1151
P/U 260 K# LITH: 75% Sand 25% Shale & 0%Silt BKG GAS 1050
S/0 230 K# FLARE: 20' CONN GAS 1650
ROT. 240 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 3082
FUEL Used: 1864  On Hand: 4999 Co.Man Scott Alired TRIP GAS
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Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/25/06 lDays: 26
Depth: 12194’ |Prog: _ 128' |DHrs: 23 |AVROP: 56 |Formation: GRASSY
DMC: $2.523  |TMC: $78,929 TDC: $48,002 |cwe: $1,539,653
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 lMud Co: M-l DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.3 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm  [Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: 3 -
VIS: 41 SPM: 113  [Size: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 14/19 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Type: K503BPX fint. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 12/35/43 IsPm: IMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 124 |GPM: 409 |sN: JW5397 lFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ JPress: 2091  oets: 1.2 Well Head: $ - Water: 3 -
Solids: 12.8 lavbc: 343 lbout: TBG/Rods: 3 - Fuel: $ 20479
Sand: AV DP: 208 |pepthin: 11582 lPackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
|pH : 9.0 JetVel: 111 IFTG: 612’ Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PH/Mf: 216 ECD: 10.75 IHrs: 143 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |[sPr#1: 50 @ 540|FPH: 4.3 JHeater: 3 - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 140 |sPR#2: 50 @ 520|woB: 10/20 IPumping uT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,645
Dapp ppb: 5 iBtm.Up: 56  JR-RPM: 70 Prime Mover: 3 - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 365 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 489.0 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2523
06:00 14:00 8:00 |DRLG 12066 - 12106' (40'@ 5 FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 105
14:00 14:30 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: 3 -
14:30 15:00 0:30 J[WORK ON PASON UNIT Daily Total: $ 48,002
15:00 06.00 15:00 |DRLG 12106 - 12194' (88'@ 5.8' FPH) Cum. Witr: $ 22,449
Cum. Fuel $ 191 ,608
Cum. Bits: $ 43500
BHA # 3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .90 1 32.23
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
1747 DCs | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 672.97
Survey 21/4° 11227
24.00 Survey 2 1/4° 1151
P/U 260 K# LITH: 50% Sand 25% Shale & 25%Silt BKG GAS 350
S/0 230 K# FLARE: 20' CONN GAS 1132
ROT. 240 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 858" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 2176
FUEL Used: 1633  On Hand: 11503 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS
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Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/26/06 Days: 27
Depth:  12362' |Prog: _ 168' |DHrs: _ 101/2 |[AVROP:  16.0 _|Formation: SUNNYSIDE
DMC: $1,993  [TMe: $80,922 TDC: $34,056 |cwc: $1,573,709
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 SPM: 113  [size: 77/8 7 7/8 |surf. csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PV/YP: 16/19 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Type: K503BPX | DSX199 [int. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 12/32/40 |spm: me: STC | HYC |prodcss:  $ - [Rentass: $ 1,500
WL: 14 GPM : 409 S/N: JW5397 109572 IFloat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ |Press: 2091  |Jets: 1.2 3X14-3X18 [Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 13 AV DC: 343 o out: 12202 TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel 3 -
Sand: AV DP: 208 [oepth In: 11582 12202 |Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
IPH : 9.0 JetVel: 111 lFTG: 620' 160  [ranks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfle: .2/5.8 |ecp: 10.86 IHrs: 144 9 Separator: 3 - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |sPr#1: 50 @ 540IFPH: 4.3 17.7  [Heater: $ - |Bits: $ 8,500
Ca : 160 SPR#2: 50 @ 520]woB: 10/20 10/15 IPumping uT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,208
|papp ppb: 5 |Btm.up: 57 |rR-RPM: 70 55 PrimeMoverr  $ - [Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: 365 53 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 499.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,993
06:00 07:30 1:30 |DRLG 12194 - 12202' (8' @ 5.3' FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 105
07:30 08.00 0:30 |PUMP PILL DROP SURVEY @ 12202' ( 29) Csg. Crew: $ -
08:00 13:30 5:30 |TOOH Daily Total: $ 34,056
13:30 14:30 1:00 JR/RMUD, BIT Cum. Witr: $ 22,449
14:30 20:00 5:30 |TIH Cum. Fuel $ 191,608
20:00 21:00 1:00 [FILL PIPE AND REAM 60’ (NO FILL) Cum. Bits: $ 52,000
21:00 06:00 9:00 |DRLG 12202 - 12362' (160'@ 17.7'FPH) BHA#3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 33.02
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DCl 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
ls1/4bCs | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.76
Survey |21/4°| 1151
24.00 Survey 2° 12202'
PV 260 K# LITH: 70% Sand 30% Shale & 0%Silt BKG GAS 1200
SIO 230 K# FLARE: 20' CONN GAS 1757
ROT. 240 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 5661
FUEL Used: 1258  On Hand: 10288 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS 5661
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Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/27/06 |Days: 28
Depth: _ 12605 |Prog: _ 243 [DHrs:  231/2 |AVROP: __ 10.3 |rormation: ABERDEEN
DMC: $2,819  |TMC: $83,741 TDC: $27.877 |owe: $1,601,585
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: 10.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 6 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 40 SPM: 104 |size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 14/18 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: DSX199 jint. csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 12/31/40 JsPm: ImMFG: HYC IProd Csg: $ - Rentals: $ 1,500
WL 152 |opm: 383 lom: 109572 [Floateaue:  $ - [trucking: $ :
Cake: 1/ |JPress: 1980 {Jets: 3X14-3X18 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 13 AV DC: 321 Jmoout: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
Sand: AV DP: 195 |DepthIn: 12202 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
JPH : 9.0 JetVel: 118 |FTG: 403 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
Pf/Mf: 2/5.7 |ecp: 10.91 IHrs: 321/2 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 4000 |sPrR#1: 50 @ 540|FPH: 124 Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 160 SPR#2: 50 @ 520]woB: 10/15 IPumping uT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,703
Dapp ppb: 5 iBtm.Up: 62 |r-RPM: 55 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. {m-rPM: 53 IMisc: $ - [Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 523.0 IDaily Total: $ - |oritling Mud: $ 2,819
06:00 15:30 9:30 IDRLG 12362 - 12489 (127'@ 13.3' FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 105
15:30 16:00 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: 3 -
16:00 06:00 14:00 [DRLG 12489 - 12605' (116'@ 8.2' FPH) Daily Total: $ 27,877
Cum. Wtr: $ 22,449
Cum. Fuel $ 191 ,608
Cum. Bits: $ 43,500
BHA #3
BIT 1 1.00
MM .13 1 33.02
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DCl 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DC's | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.76
Survey 2 1/4° 1151
24.00 Survey 2° 12202'
P/U 260 K# LITH: 80% Sand 20% Shale & 0%Silt BKG GAS 1200
S0 230 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 2432
ROT. 240 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 5170
FUEL Used: 2046  On Hand: 8242 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS N/A
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Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: DRLG 03/28/06 |[Days: 29
Depth:  12798' |Prog: _ 193' |DHrs: 23 1/2 |AVROP: 82 |Formation: SPRING CANYON
DMC: $3,032  |TMC: $86,773 TDC: $28,090 Jewe: $1,629,675
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
jmw: 10.4 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: 6 Conductor: 3 - Loc,Cost: $ -
vIS: 41 SPM: 109 |size: 7718 Surf. Csg: $ - |RigMove: $ -
PVIYP: 14/19 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm [Type: DSX199 Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 12/38/47 §spPm: IMFG: HYC IProd Csg: $ - |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: 14 GPM : 402 |siN: 109572 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ |Press: 2100 |Jets: 3X14-3X18 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 14.4 |avoc: 337 |mout TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet: $ -
Sand: AV DP: 205 |pepth In: 12202 Jrackers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
|Ph : 9.0 JetVel: 124 IFTG: 596' Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
E’fIMf: .2/6.3 |ecD: 10.85 IHrs: 56 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 JIsPR#1: 50 Q540|FPH: 10.6 |Heater: $ - Isits: $ -
Ca : 160 SPR#2: 50 @ 520|wos: 15/20 IPumping UT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,703
Dapp ppb: 5.2 |Btm.Up: 62 |R-RPM: 55 lPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [m-rPM: 53 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 546.5 |Daily Total: $ - |orilling Mud: 3 3,032
06:00 11:30 5:30 |DRLG 12605 - 12649' (40'@ 7.2' FPH) Misc. / Labor: $ 105
11:30 12:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
12:00 06:00 | 18:00 |DRLG 12649 - 12798' (149'@ 8.2' FPH ) Daily Total: $ 28,090
Cum. Wtr: $ 22,449
Cum. Fuel $ 191,608
Cum. Bits: $ 52,000
BHA # 3
BIT 1 1.00
jmm 13 1 33.02
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC| 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
614'DCs | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.76
Survey 2 1/4° 1151
24.00 Survey 2° 12202
P/IU 275 K# LITH: 90% Sand 0% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 2300
S/0 230 K# FLARE: 10 CONN GAS 3172
ROT. 255 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 5437
FUEL Used: 2473 On Hand: 5769 Co.Man Scott Alired TRIP GAS N/A
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Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: RIG UP TO RUN LOGS 03/29/06 Ipays: 30
Depth: 12925 |Prog: 127’ |DHrs: 13 1/2 |AVROP: 9.4  |Formationn  SPRING CANYON (TD)
DMC: $2,255 ITMC: $89,028 TDC: $26,163 JCWC: $1,655,837
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
ImMw: 10.5 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Bit #: 6 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 48 SPM: 109 [size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: 3 - Rig Move: 3 -
lpvive: 15/24 | #2F-10003.5gpm |[Type: DSX199 Jint. csg: $ - |payRate: $ 19,000
Gel: 17/42/59 jsPm: IMFG: HYC IProd Csg: $ - Rentals: 3 1,500
WL: 14.8 [GPM: 402 |sn,: 109572 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ Press: 2250 |uets: 3X14-3X18 Well Head: 3 - Water: 3 -
Solids: 14.4 javDC: 337 [TDoOut: 12925 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: 3 -
Sand: AV DP: 205 iDepth In: 12202 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: 3 850
PH : 9.0 JetVel: 124 IFTG: 723 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
PHMF: .2/5.8 |ecD: 11.06 lHrs: 69 1/2 Separator: 3 - Cement: 3 -
Chlor: 4000 |sPR#1: S(MOIFPH: 10.4 |Heater: $ - sits: $ -
Ca : 120 sPR#2: 50 @ 520|woB: 15/20 IPumping uT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 1,553
Dapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 62 |rrPM: 55 IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |M-RPM: 53 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 52 Total Rot. Hrs: 536.5 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2255
06:00 19:30 13:30 |DRLG 12798 - 12925' (127' @ 9.4 FPH) Misc. / Labor: 3 105
19:30 22:00 2:30 |CIRC. AND COND HOLE FOR LOGS Csg. Crew: $ -
22:00 22:30 0:30 |PUMP PILL and DROP SURVEY @ 12925-- 1 3/4° Daily Total: $ 26,163
22:30 04:00 5:30 |[TOOH Cum. Wtr: $ 22,449
04:00 0430 0:30 JLAY DOWN MUD MOTOR Cum. Fuel $ 191,608
04:30 05:00 0:30 |SAFETY MEETING W/ LOGERS Cum. Bits: $ 52,000
05:00 06:00 1:00 JRIG UP TO RUN LOGS BHA#3
BIT 1 1.00
TD @ 19:00 ON 03/28/2006 MM .13 1 33.02
IBS 1 4.54
1-61/4"DC 1 29.70
IBS 1 4.63
61/4"DCs | 20 600.87
TOTAL BHA = 673.76
Survey 2° 12202'
24.00 Survey 13/4 12925'
P/U 275 K# LITH: 90% Sand 0% Shale & 10%Silt BKG GAS 2300
S/I0 230 K# FLARE: 10' CONN GAS 3172
ROT. 255 Kit LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS 5437
FUEL Used: 2061 On Hand: 4830 Co.Man Scott Alired TRIP GAS N/A
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GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
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AFE # 40026 7,75 A/ JF 5230 4/ 3-04p-36093

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: LAY DOWN DP 03/30/06 Days: 31
Depth: 12925 |Prog: 0 [pHs: O [AVROP:  #DIV/O! [Formation: _ SPRING CANYON (TD )
DMC: $2,832 ITMC: $91,860 TDC: $75,261 |CWC: $1,731,098
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
{mw: 10.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm  [Bit#: R/R Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 50 SPM: 109 [size: 77/8 Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 21/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm | Type: PB45H Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 12/37/44 |spm: MFG: SMITH [proacss: 5 - |Rentas: $ 1,500
WL: 12 GPM : 402 s, PB33766 IFIoat Equp: 3 - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ Press: 2250 |Jets: 3X20 Well Head: 3 - |water: $ -
Solids: 12 AV DC: 337 |mpout: 12925 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel 3$ -
Sand: AV DP: 205 |DepthIn: 12925 Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
IpH : 9.0 JetVel: 124 IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 50,074
leIMf: .2/5.8 |ecp: 11.18 IHrs: Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |sPr#1: 50 @LM)IFPH: |Heater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 120 sPR#2: 50 @ 520|wos: IPumping UT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
Dapp ppb: 5 Btm.Up: 62 |r-rRPM: |Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [M-RPM: IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 900
START END Time | 53.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 523.0 lDain Total: $ - |Orilling Mud: $ 2,832
06:00 14:00 8:00 |RUN IN AND LOG WELL Misc. / Labor: $ 105
14:00 14:30 0:30 |RIG DOWN LOGGERS Csg. Crew: $ -
14:30 16:30 2:00 |TIH TO 3500' Daily Total: $ 75,261
16:30 18:30 2:00 |CUT DRLG LINR Cum. Wtr: $ 22,449
18:30 19:30 1:00 JWORK ON DYOMATIC Cum. Fuel $ 191,608
19:30 24:00 4:30 |TIH Cum. Bits: $ 52,000
24:00 03.00 3:00 |CIRC. AND COND HOLE TO RUN CASING BHA#3
03:00 05:30 2:30 |[TOOH LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE BIT 1 1.00
05:30 06:00 0:30 |REPLACE LOW DRUM CHAIN BIT SUB 1
61/4"'DC's | 21 603.57
TOTAL BHA = 604.57
Survey 2° 12202’
24.00 Survey 1 3/4° 12925'
PV 275 K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O 230 K# FLARE: 10 CONN GAS
ROT. 255 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 662 On Hand: 4168 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO GASCO ENERGY Lol FIDENTIAL

DAILY DRILLING REPORT

Energy AFE#40026 7075 p/7F SRO Y3-0Y7-36093
Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: RUN 4 1/2 CASING 03/31/06 |Days: 32
Depth:  12925' |Prog: 0 |[DHrs: O [AVROP:  #DIV/O! [Formation:  SPRING CANYON ( TD )
DMC: $689 lTMC: $92,549 TDC: $73,118 |CWC: $1,804,216
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-1 DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
jmw: 10.7 #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #: Conductor: 3 - Loc,Cost: 3 -
VIS: 50 SPM: 109 |size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: 3 -
pvrve: 21/20 #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Type: Jint. csq: $ - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: 12/37/44 |sem: we: [prodcs: 5 - |Rentass: $ 1,500
WL: 12 GPM : 402 [siN: IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1/ JPress: 2250 |Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: 12 AV DC: 337 |mout TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel $ -
Sand: AV DP: 205 |pepth In: [Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
PH 9.0 JetVel: 124 IFTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ 50,074
Ff/Mf: .2/15.8 [eco: 11.18 IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 4000 |sPr#1: 50 @ 540|FPH: JHeater: $ - |sits: $ -
Ca : 120 JsPr#2: 50 @ 520|wos: IPumping LT: $ - Mud Motors: 3 -
Dapp ppb: 5 |Btm.uUp: 62 |R-RPM: IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. [m-rem: IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 53.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 523.0 |Daily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 689
06.00 09:00 3.00 |REPLACE LOW DRUM CHAIN Misc. / Labor: $ 105
09.00 16:00 7:00 |LAY DOWN DP Csg. Crew: $ -
16:00 18:00 2:00 |BREAK AND LAY DOWN KELLY , PULL ROT. RUBBER Daily Total: $ 73,118
18:00 20:00 2:00 JLAY DOWN BHA Cum. Wtr: $ 22,449
20:00 22:30 2:30 JRU CASING CREW AND SAFETY MEETING Cum. Fuel $ 191,608
22:30 05:30 7:00 |RUN 4 1/2 CASING Cum. Bits: $ 52,000
05:30 06:00 0:30 |INSTALL ROT RUBBER BHA#3
BIT 1 1.00
BIT SUB 1
ls1/4"DCs | 21 603.57
TOTAL BHA = 604.57
Survey 2° 12202'
24.00 Survey 1 3/4° 12925'
PIU 275 Ki# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 230 K# FLARE: 10 CONN GAS
ROT. 255 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 662 On Hand: 4168 Co.Man Scott Allred TRIP GAS




GASCO ENERGY oo

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
AFE#40026 7S ¥ /7E S0 4 Fo0y9-36073

GASCO
Energy

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: RIG DOWN FLOOR 04/01/06 IDays: 33
Depth: 12925 |Prog: 0' |DHrs: 0 |av ROP: Formaton:  SPRING CANYON ( TD)
DMC: $0 [Tmc: $91,860 TDC: $399,915 Jowc: $2,131,013
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 Mud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
EMW: #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm hBit #: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: 3 -
lpvrye: #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm ] Type: Jint. csg: 3 - Day Rate: $ 19,000
Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ 231,696 |Rentals: $ 1,500
WL: GPM : SIN: [Fioat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: 3 -
Solids: AV DC: TD OQut: TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
Sand: AV DP: |pepth in: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ 850
JPH : JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: 3 - Logging: $ 50,074
IPf/Mf: Jeco: IHrs: Separator: 3 - |Cement: $ 74,531
Chior: SPR#1: 50 @ 540|FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : SPR#2: 50 @ 520]woB: IPumping uUT: $ - Mud Motors: 3 -
Dapp ppb: |Btm.Up: 62 |rRRPM: IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. |[M-RPM: lMisc: $ - |consuitant: $ 900
START END TIME 53.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 523.0 IDain Total: $ 231,696 |Drilling Mud: $ -
06.00 11.30 5:30 {RUN 302 JTS 4 1/2, 13.5# P-110 CASING LAND @ 12872 Misc. / Labor: $ 105
11:30 14:00 2:30 JCIRC. COND. HOLE Csg. Crew: $ 21,259
14:00 15:00 1.00 |RD CASING CREW Daily Total: $ 399,915
15:00 15:30 0:30 JRU CEMENT CREW Cum. Wtr: $ 22449
15:30 19:00 3:30 JCEMENT W/ 20BBLS. CW100, 500 SKS. HI-LIFT+ADD LEAD Cum. Fuel $ 191,608
19:00 (YIELD =3.04, H20=18.4GI/SKS@11.5PPG.) Cum. Bits: $ 52,000
0 1845 SKS 50/50P0Z G +ADDS TAIL (YIELD=1.28 H20=5.91 BHA # 3
0 GL/SK @14.1PPG.) DISP. TO FLOAT W/ 190BBLS. KCL WATER
0 19:00 CEMENT TO SURFACE @ 140 BBLS. INTO DISP.
19:00 20.00 1.00 |RD CEMENTERS
20:00 03:00 7:00 JCLEAN CEMENT OUT OF BOP'S AND CLEAN TANKS
03:00 06:00 3:00 JRIG DOWN FLOOR
RIG RELEASED AT 03:00 HRS. ON 04/01/2006
TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey
24.00 Survey
P/U 275 K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/O 230 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 255 Ki# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 662 On Hand: 4168 Co.Man Scott Alired TRIP GAS




GASCO

Energy

GASCO ENERGY E :‘=: E

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
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AFE # 40026 7 095 R /95 Sw00YI-OYn36093

Well: Fed.12-20-9-19 Oper: RIG DOWN FINAL REPORT 04/02/06 lDays: 34
Depth:  12925' |Prog: 0' |DHrs: 0 |av ROP: Formaton:  SPRING CANYON (TD)
DMC: $0 ITMC: $91,860 TDC: $18,600 JCWC: $2,222,731
Contractor: NABORS RIG 270 IMud Co: M-I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE COST INTANGIBLE COST
MW: #1 F-1000 3.5 gpm IBit #. Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: 3 -
PVIYP: #2 F-1000 3.5 gpm |Type: Jint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 17,100
Gel: SPM: JVFG: IProd Csg: $ - Rentals: $ 500
WL: GPM : SIN: lFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -
Cake: [Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: TD Out: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: AV DP: |Depth In: {Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
|PH : JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: 3 - Logging: 3 -
Pf/Mf: |eco: IHrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: SPR#1: 50 @ 540|FPH: JHeater: 3 - |sits: $ -
Ca : SPR#2: 50 @ 520jwos: IPumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: iBtm.Up: 62 |R-RPM: IPrime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ -
Time Break Down: Total D.T. IM-RPM: IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 900
START END TIME 53.5 Total Rot. Hrs: 523.0 IDain Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -
06:00 18:00 12:00 JRIG DOWN FLOOR AND LAY DERRICK OVER, UNSTRING Misc. / Labor: $ 100
BLOCKS AND GET READY TO LOAD OUT TRUCKS Csg. Crew: $ -
MOVE TO LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 Daily Total: $ 18,600
FINAL REPORT Cum. Wir: $ 22449
RIG RELEASED AT 03:00 HRS. ON 04/01/2006 Cum. Fuel $ 191,608
Cum. Bits: $ 52,000
BHA#3
TOTAL BHA = 0.00
Survey
24.00 Survey
P/U 275 K# LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 230 K# FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 255 K# LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET@ 3530 PEAK GAS
FUEL Used: 662 On Hand: 4168 Co.Man Scott Alired TRIP GAS
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GHSCO PROPUCT 10 Co
Federal 12-209-19 7 075 K/9Z s—=0
Y 3~0y9— 36093
1 Mohe Completion 1* stage — Black Hawk / Spring Canyon, Aberdeen,
Kennilworth

4/12/06 Rig up SLB and run CCL/ Gama Ray / Bond log. Shows good bond to
surface.

4/14/06 Rig up B&C Quick test and pressure test CSG to 9500 psi. Test good .

4/20/06 Rig up SLB wireline and RIH w/ guns for stage #1 Spring Canyon /

Aberdeen, Kennilworth and perf @ 12,477-80, 12,588-91, 12,724-28, 3
spf. Rig up SLB frac crew (Grand Junction, Kevin). Broke dn perfs @
5712 psi @ 4.6 bpm. ISIP 4950. FG . 83. Calc 20 holes open / 30.
Hybrid fraced Stg 1 w/ 153,515# 20-40 Optiprop, using 3145 bbls YF 125,
WF 118, and YF 120 gel. ISIP 5040. FG .84. Was never able to get to
full rate of designed job. Early in job, was able to get to 37 — 39 bpm
(supposed to be 40 bpm). As job progressed, rate continued to fall off.
Had trouble w/ several frac pumps (1 wouldn’t go into lock up, down all
job). Finished job w/ rate @ 29 — 30 bpm. Blender intermittently would
fall off and lose discharge pressure. Flushed wellbore w/ 184.1 bbls, @
29 — 30 bpm. ISIP 5040. FG .84. Opened well up to FB @ 2:45 PM on
10/64” ck w/ 5000 SICP. Will temperature log perfs to see if all 3
benches were fraced properly and lower rates. (SCE)

4/21/06 Well flowing this AM @ 3300 psi on a 14/64 ck. Made 1036 bbls in 10 2
hrs. TR 1036, BLWTR 2109. Rig up SLB wireline and RIH w/ plug and
guns for stage #2. Set 9 Y2 k FTFP @ 12,178 w/ 3800 psi on well bore.
Perf stage # 2 Blackhawk / Desert / Grassy @ 12,054-57°, 12,156-60°.
Broke down perfs @ 6176 psi @ 10 BPM. ISIP 4330. FG .80. Calc shots
open 18 open out of / 21. Hybrid frac stage #2 w/ 10,000 # 20/40 SB Excel
and 65,268 # 20/40 Opti Prop sand, using 2300 bbls YF and WF 118 gel.
Flushed well w/ 177.8 bbls @ 30 bpm. ISIP 4840. FG .84. Turn well over
to flow back @ 11:35 am @ 4700 psi on a 10/64 ck. Close well in W/
4100 psi and RIH w/ plug and guns for stage #3 Lower Mesaverde set
FTFP #2 @ 11,574’ pressure test plug to 8500 psi and hold 1000 psi over
while shooting PERFS @ 11,237-40°, 11,307-10°, 11,326-29’, 11,546-
50°. Pressure fell on 11,326-29° guns when shot. Pump 1 BPM to maintain
psi until wireline was out of hole. Break down perfs @ 4790 @ 4 BPM.
ISIP 4450. FG .83 . Calc shots open 22 out of 39. Hybrid frac stage #3 w/
100630# of 20/40 SB Excel sand using 2600 bbls of YF and WF118 gel.
Flushed well w/ 165 bbls @ 45 BPM. ISIP 4475, FG .83. Turn well over
to flowback @ 6:30 pm @ 4500 psi on a 10/64 ck. (CR / SCE)

RECEIVED
APR 2 4 2006

IV OF OIL, GAS & MINING



4/22/06

Well flowing this AM @ 2900 FCP on 14/64” ck. Made 1567 bbls in 16
Y2 hrs. TR 2603. BLWTR 2841. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stg 4 —
Lower Mesaverde. Set FTFP #3 @ 11138’. Psi test plug to 8500 psi. At
7900 psi, bottom gun inadvertently fired. Off depth shots were @ 10958 —
62’ (coincidently, where we were going to shoot “perf only” holes).
POOH. RIH w/ redressed gun and perforated f/ 11012 - 15°, 11099 -
102°, 11116 —20°, 3 spf. Perfs 1/ 10978 — 80° were cancelled due to
extra holes. SLB determined that Owens sub only 10k psi rated, in a 15K
gun system. Redesigned frac to x-link gel, instead of Hybrid frac.
Pumped into perfs @ 1.5 bpm to maintain positive psi on FTFP for a total
of 56 bbls. Fd 3925 SICP. Pumped into perfs (no break dn) @ 4370 @
6.1 bpm. Calc 25 holes open / 42. Gel fraced Stg 4 w/ 81,235# (into
formation) 20-40 SB Excel, using 1528 bbls YF 118 gel. Screened out to
8500 psi, leaving 10,500# of 5 ppg sd in csg. Got 70 bbls flush away.
Opened well up to FB @ 4:50 PM on 12/64” ck w/ 3400 SICP. (SCE and
CR)



Form 3 160-5
(August 1999)

UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004-0135
Expires Jnovember 30. 2000

5. Lease Serial No.

UTU-75090

6. If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Name

NA

7. If Unit or CA/Agreement. Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE — Other instructions on reverse side

1. Type of Well NA

Well Name and No.
Federal 12-20-9-19

[Joi wen X} Gaswell [ Other , Is.

2. Name of Operator

9. API Well No.
43-047-36093

Gasco Production Company
3a.  Address 3b.

Phone No. (include area code)

Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area

Riverbend

8 Inverness Dr I, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 10.

4. Location of Well (Foorage. Sec.. T.. R.. M.. or Survey Description)

County or Pansh. State

1837 FNL & 846' FWI, ¥

/ 7 ~ > . _r v _ '-
SWINW of Section 20-T9S-R19k: Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ water Shut-Oft
[ Well integrity
XI Other SPHd Welt

D Production (Start/Resume)
] Reclamation
[ Recomplete

D Acidize D Deepen
D Alter Casing D Iracture Treat
D

D Casing Repair New Construction

[ Notice of Intem

[X) Subscquent Report

[ Temporarily Abandon

D Change Plans D Plug and Abandon

[Z] rinal Abandonment Notice (2 convertio Injection I Plug Back D Water Disposal

13- Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. including estimated stanling date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereol
H the proposal s to deepen directionally or secomplete honzontally | give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertment markers and 7ones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be tiled within 30 davs
following completion of the nvolved operations I the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval. a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed  Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements. induding reclamation. have been completed. and the operator has

determimed that the site 1sready for final inspection

This well was spud on 10/7/2005

APR 2 6 2006

14T hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct o -
Name (Printed/Typed) Title . . . o LA AT L ;
Beverly Walker Engineering Technictan
Signature .7 / j /( - Date
e LS Sy i A April 21, 2000
/ T THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE
Approved by Title Date
—( -():K;Il_l(:r; _0; ;p‘p;o-\«';li :l;r;y— ;r; _dl_ld_(_ ;\c_d_ _/\_p;vr_n: u—l _n; l_h‘l.S_l;ll_lC_&'_d:);S_l:(l_ \:/;r:a_nl_()r Office

cerufy that the apphicant holds legal or equnable utle 10 those nghis in the subject lease
which would entitle the apphcant to conduct operations thereon

Tite 18 U.S.C. Scction 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
false . fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as 1o any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instrucrions on reverse)



UNITED STATES

FORM APPROVED

Form 3160- 5
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March 31, 2007
5. Lease Senal No
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-75090
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. I Unit or CA. Am-"Ne'/"X Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well

Doil Well I:l()lhev

8. Well Name and No

Gas Well
2. Name of Operator

Gasco Production Company

Federal 12-20-9-19
9. APl Well No

3a. Address
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112

3b. Phone No. (iclude area code)

303-483-0044

43-047-36093
10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (l-votage. Sec.. T, R or Survey Description)

1837 FNL & 846' FWL SW NW of Section 20-T9S-R19E

Riverbend

11. County or Panish. State
Uintah County, Utah

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX{S) TO INDICATE NATUR= OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

DAcidin Dbcepcn
DAllcring Casing
D(‘asing Repan
DChange Plans

D(‘onven to Ingection

DNollce of Intent
Subsequent Repont

I:lPlug back

l:llfinal Abandonment Notice

I:I Fracture Treat
D New Construction
EIPlug and abandon

D Water Shut-ofl’
DWell Intepnity
( Jher

EFM Meter

DProduction( Start/ Resume)

I:] Reclamation
DRecomplele
I:]Temporanly Abandon
DWaler Disposal

13. Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations {(clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereol
Il the proposal s to deepen directionally or recomplete honizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent repots shall be filed within 30 days
lollowing completion of the involved operations. I the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval. a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed.  Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements. including reclamation, have been completed. and the operator has

determined that the site 1sready for final inspection

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 3500) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected

and proved according to all BLM regulations.

14. T hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed Tiped)

Beverly Walker

Title

Engineering Technician

Date

April 27, 2006

Signature, . .
NI,
Y

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by

Title

Date

Conditions of approval. if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or]
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those nghts in the subject lease]

which  would entitle  the  applicant __to  conduct __operations ___thereon

Office

MAY 0 1 2006

Tile 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)



UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

Form 3160- S
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March 31, 2007
5. Lease Senal No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-75090
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. WUnitor CA. AWE&“}‘:’XNZ""‘? and/or No
1. Type of Well

DOH Well Gas Well

E]Olher 8. Well Name and No

2. Name of Operator
Gasco Production Company

Federal 12-20-9-19
9. APl Well No

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (mclude area code) 43-047-36093
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area
4 Location of Well fl-ootage, Sec., T R AL or Survey Description) Riverbend

1837 FNL & 846' FWL SW NW of Section 20-T9S-RI19E

11, County or Pansh. State

Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

I:'Nolice of Intent
Subsequenl Report

D Final Abandonment Notice

[]/\cidize DDeepen DProducnon { Start/ Resume) I:]Waler Shut-of¥
D/\Ilenng Casing D Fracture Treat D Reclamation D Well Integrity
D(‘asmg Repair I—_—]New Constnichon DRecnmplcle D()Ihcr
D(‘hange Plans DPlug and abandon I:lTemporanly Abandon
D(‘onvcn to Injection I:IPlug back Walcr Disposal

13 Descnibe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate dusation thereol’
If the proposal 15 to deepen directionally or recomplete honizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA.  Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations.  [f the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed.  Fina! Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed. and the operator has
determmed that the site isready for final inspection

This is to inform you that we will be disposing of water from this well as follows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
Brennan bottom Water Disposal located between Roosevelt and Vernal Utah.

14. 1 hereby centify that the foregoing is true and correct

Name (P’rinted Typed)

Title
Engineering Technician

Beverly Walker’

Signatur, // . o s Date
e f//)/ /.'/T"// / ///'/.[7//// { ' April 27. 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by

Title Date oo

Conditions of approval. if any are attached. Approval of this notice does nol warrant or}

certify that the apphcant holds legal or equitable title to those nights in the subject lease}Office
which  would entitle  the  applicamt  to  conduct  operations  thereon| !!!E—; g 3 %!"!lﬁ
of "agency of the United

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 US.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any departm

States any false, ficiiousor fraudulent

or repr 10ns as to any matter within its jurnisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)



Form 3160- UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

{Apnil 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March 31. 2007
5. Lease Serial No
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-75090
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

7. 1f Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. WA

I Type of Well

I:Iou Well Gas Well DOther . . . 8. Well Name and No

2. Name of Operator . g Federal 12-20-9-19
9. APl Well No.

Gasco Production Company

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (mcinde area code) 43-047-36093
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area
4 Location of Well fl-ootage. Sec.. 1. R M., or Survey Description) Riverbend

It County or Parish, State
Uintah County, Utah
12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURYE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Dlece of Intent DAcidize DDccpcn Produc!ion { Start/ Resume) DWaler Shut-off
DAllering Casing Dl:raclllrc Treat DReclamalion DWC" Integrity
Suhsequem Report D(‘asing Repaw DNcw Construction DRccomplclc [___—l()lher
DChange Plans DPIug and abandon D'Temporarily Abandon
DFmal Abandonment Notice D(‘onven to Injection DPlug back DWaler Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. including estmated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete hornizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true verticat depths of all pestinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA.  Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. if the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval. a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed  Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afier all requirements. including reclamation, have been completed. and the opertor has
determined that the site 1sready for final inspection

1837 FNL & 846' FWL. SW NW of Section 20-T9S-R19E

This well was started on production on 4,23/2006

14 | hereby certify that the foregomng is true and correct
Name (Printed Typed)

Title

Beverly Walkey Engineering Technician

SN S S o April 27,2006
/ a4

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or|
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which  would entitle  the applicant 1o conduct __ operations __thereon,
Title 18 US.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agEn&ySf Ve - Uritéd-- e
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matier within its junsdiction o Cme

(Instructions on page 2) MAY 0 ' 2006




LASCO PROSUCTIONCS

Federal 12-20-9-19 T 095 R ITE5-50

yz-097-36073
1’ Mobe Completion 1" stage — Black Hawk / Spring Canyon, Aberdcen,
Kennilworth

4/12/06 Rig up SLB and run CCL/ Gama Ray / Bond log. Shows good bond to
surface.

4/14/06 Rig up B&C Quick test and pressure test CSG to 9500 psi. Test good.

4/20/06 Rig up SLB wireline and RIH w/ guns for stage #1 Spring Canyon /

Aberdeen, Kennilworth and perf @ 12.477-80, 12,588-91, 12,724-28, 3
spf. Rig up SLB frac crew (Grand Junction, Kevin). Broke down perfs @
5712 psi @ 4.6 bpm. ISIP 4950. FG .83. Calc 20 holes open / 30.
Hybrid fraced Stg 1 w/ 153,5154 20-40 Optiprop, using 3145 bbls YF
125, WF 118, and YF 120 gel. ISIP 5040. FG .84. Was never able to get
to full rate of designed job. Early in job, was able to get to 37 — 39 bpm
(supposed to be 40 bpm). As job progressed, rate continued to fall off.
Had trouble w/ several frac pumps (1 wouldn’t go into lock up, down all
job). Finished job w/ rate @ 29 — 30 bpm. Blender intermittently would
fall off and lose discharge pressure. Flushed wellbore w/ 184.1 bbls, @
29 — 30 bpm. ISIP 5040. FG .84. Opened well up to FB @ 2:45 PM on
10/64” ck w/ 5000 SICP. Will temperature log perfs to see if all 3
benches were fraced properly and lower rates. (SCE)

4/21/06 Well flowing this AM @ 3300 psi on a 14/64 ck. Made 1036 bbls in 10 %2
hrs. TR 1036, BLWTR 2109. Rig up SLB wireline and RIH w/ plug and
guns for stage #2. Set 9 % k FTFP @ 12,178 w/ 3800 psi on well bore.
Perf stage # 2 Blackhawk / Desert / Grassy @ 12,054-57°, 12,156-60".
Broke down perfs @ 6176 psi @ 10 BPM. ISIP 4330. FG .80. Calc shots
open 18 open out of / 21. Hybrid frac stage #2 w/ 10,000 # 20/40 SB
Excel and 65,268 # 20/40 Opti Prop sand, using 2300 bbls YF and WF
118 gel. Flushed well w/ 177.8 bbls @ 30 bpm. ISIP 4840. FG .84. Turn
well over to flow back @ 11:35 am @ 4700 psi on a 10/64 ck. Close well
in W/ 4100 psi and RIH w/ plug and guns for stage #3 Lower Mesaverde
set FTFP #2 @ 11,574 pressure test plug to 8500 psi and hold 1000 psi
over while shooting PERFS @ 11,237-40°, 11,307-10°, 11,326-29’,
11,546-50". Pressure fell on 11,326-29’ guns when shot. Pump 1 BPM to
maintain psi until wireline was out of hole. Break down perfs @ 4790 @ 4
BPM. ISIP 4450. FG .83. Calc shots open 22 out of 39. Hybrid frac stage
#3 w/ 1006304 of 20/40 SB Excel sand using 2600 bbls of YF and
WF118 gel. Flushed well w/ 165 bbls @ 45 BPM. ISIP 4475, FG 83

Turn well over to flowback @ 6:30 pm @ 4500 psi on a 10/64 ck. %
SCE) IVED

MAY 19 2006
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



4/22/06

5/17/06

5/18/06

5/19/06

Well flowing this AM @ 2900 FCP on 14/64” ck. Made 1567 bbls in 16
% hrs. TR 2603. BLWTR 2841. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stg 4 —
Lower Mesaverde. Set FTFP #3 @ 11138°. Psi test plug to 8500 psi. At
7900 psi, bottom gun inadvertently fired. Off depth shots were @ 10958 —
62’ (coincidently, where we were going to shoot “perf only” holes).
POOH. RIH w/ redressed gun and perforated {f/ 11012 — 15°, 11099 —
102°, 11116 — 20°, 3 spf. Perfs f/ 10978 — 80° were cancelled due to extra
holes. SLB determined that Owens sub only 10k psi rated, in a 15K gun
system. Redesigned frac to x-link gel, instead of Hybrid frac. Pumped
into perfs @ 1.5 bpm to maintain positive psi on FTFP for a total of 56
bbls. Fd 3925 SICP. Pumped into perfs (no break dn) @ 4370 @ 6.1
bpm. Calc 25 holes open / 42. Gel fraced Stg 4 w/ 81,235# (into
formation) 20-40 SB Excel, using 1528 bbls YF 118 gel. Screened out
to 8500 psi, leaving 10,500# of 5 ppg sd in csg. Got 70 bbls flush away.
Opened well up to FB @ 4:50 PM on 12/64” ck w/ 3400 SICP. (SCE and
CR)

MORU service unit, rig up pump and tank. Pump 90 bbls to control well.
NDFT and NUBOP, tally pipe and pick up 3 % bit, POBS, X-nipple. RIH
w/ 215 jts leaving EOT @ 6800’. Return well down sales and shut down
for night. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 10,503 CCC §$ 10,503

Well flowing this AM @ 1600 psi. RIH w/ 129 jts (344 total) and tag up
@ 10,894, pick up swivel and break circ. Drill out plugs and clean out to
PBTD @ 12,854. Circulate bottoms up and POOH w/ 69 jts laying down.
Rig up swab and broach tbg, return well to sales for night and shut down.
(Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 7529 CCC $ 18,032

Well flowing this AM @ 1400 psi. Land tbg @ 10,656 w/ 336 jts, drop
ball and pump bit off @ 1000 psi. return well to sales and RDMO. (Rick
w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 1841 CCC § 19,873



Form 3160- § UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-75090
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnitor CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well
DOiI Well Gas Well DOther 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator See list below
Gasco Production Company 9. APl Well No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (loorage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)
11. County or Parish, State

12.  CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Nolice of Intent DAcidize I:’Deepen DProduciion ( Start/ Resume) I:IWaler Shut-off
DAllering Casing D Fracture Treat D Reclamation D Well Integrity
E]Subsequem Report DCasing Repair DNew Construction DRecomplete I:IOIher
DChange Plans I:IPIug and abandon DTemporarily Abandon
I:]Final Abandonment Nofice DConven to Injection DPlug back Waler Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly siate all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed  Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the openator has
determined that the site isready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that effective immediately we will be disposing of produced

water from wells withir_ *his lease as follows:
All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
State Evaporation Facility NW 1/4 of Section 36-T9S-Ri18E Uintah County, Utah. Which is owned by

Gasco Production Company. A copy of the approved permit for this facility is attached. ACCED 1ol s

Utah W‘{

Oil, (A8 7

The wells within this lease are: nee YR

'ﬁ' Federal 12-20-9-19 SW NW of Sec 20-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-36093 FQE& o
Federal 24-20-9-19 SE SW of Sec 20-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-34168

Federal 44-20-9-19 SE SE of Sec 20-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-34169 REC SIVED

OCT 2 4 2006
DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed Typed)
Title
Beverly Walker, Engineering Tech
Signature, . Date
(%//2 i // //,//,(e October 18, 2006
/7 / THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or}
centify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease]Office
which  would entitle  the  applicant 1o conduct  operations __thereon,|
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a cnme for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudul or repr ions as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)




OCT 27 2006 11:44AM HP LASERJET 3200 p.2

srareor CONFIDENTIAL —

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURGES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING §. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
- . UTU-75090
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS R G AT o e
Domtml\lslomfwmmdsmmlnnw.ﬂs. significanily despen wells below cument botiom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, of to 7.Nl;xTorCAAGREBENTNM£
horizontsl leierais. Liss APPLIGATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposal.
PTTROES T owwew [0 caswew B OTHER, _ S EOERAL 1220619
“Z NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER.

GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY : 4304736093
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER ™10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILOCAT:
8 INVERNESS DRIVE ESTE ... ENGLEWOOD srare CO 180112 (303) 483-0044 RIVERBEND
€ LOCATION OF WELL

FooTAGES AT SURFACE: 1837° FNL X 846" FWL county: UINTAH

QTRATR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE. MERIDIAN: SWNW 20 98 19E S STATE:

UTAH
" CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOFSUBMISSION | TYPE OF ACTION _
NOTICE OF INTENT ] acioize [ veeren . [[] RePeRFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
‘ {Subsni in Dupficate) [J MTERcasing FRACTURE TREAT [] semrackro ReFARWELL
Approvimete date work wil atart D CASING REPAIR ] wew consTRUCTION [[] TEMPORARILY ABANDON
11/1/2006 [ crance To PREVIOUS PLANS [] oPeraTor cHance [ Tuemererar
[} crancetuene [ Fuue anoasanoon ] ventorpare
3 sussequenT REPORT [J cHANGE WELL NAME [ museack [[] warer msrosac
(Submit Diiginal Form Only)
] D CHANGE WELL STATUS E' PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) D WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work compietion:
7] cOMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [] RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O oner
] converTwerL Tvee /] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION
- —

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Claarly show all partinent details including dates, depths, volumes, aic.

Gasco intends to complete all productive intervals in the Mesaverde and Wasatch formations, and to commingle production
from thesa intervals. Following the final fracture stimulation, a Completion Report containing the perforation and simulation
specifics for each zone completed will be submitted.  required, the method used to account for and to allocate production
from each pool so commingled will be by individual interval hydrocarbon pore volume calculation.

Gasco Production Company has provided the owners of all contiguous cil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the pools to
be commingled with a copy of this application, and has requested that they waive their right to the 15-day period of objection
per UDOGM Rule 649-3-22(3). Copies of emails or faxes from these owners, verifying their waivers, are attached. Additionalty,
Gasco has acquired Brek Energy Comp., and herewith waives its right to objection. Gasco therefore respectfully requests that
the Division accept this application, with attachments, in lisu of the required affidavit with regard to notification of the
aforementioned owners.

Attachments:

1. Exhibit showing the location of all wells on, and the lease owners of, contiguous oll and gas lease or drilling units overlying
the subject pools.

2. Capies of waiver-of-objection emails from offset lease awners (Newfield, Stone, Yates eta).

3. News release regarding Gasco acquisition of Brek Energy Corp. (%20/2006)

NAUE PLEASE prmvyy_ANthony W. Sharp % mme Senior Engineer
e 10/27/2006

SIGNATURE

(Thie space for $iate use only)

coderal Approval O‘Iyms
ol
hction s NeoE> RECEIVED

i OCT & 7 200
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(8/2000)
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UTU-76033
GPC 75.00
BREK 25.00

"UTU-75080 NW/4

GPC 76.25

BREK 8.75

STONE 7.65
NEWFIELD 7.35 -
(B GRRV-11650)
GPC 85.00 |
STONE 7.65
NEWFIELD 7.35

| (11650-12825)

2eS

FEDERAL
12-20

eptyt

FEDERAL
43-19

UTU-75090 SW/4
GPC 63.75
BREK 21.25
STONE 7.65
NEWFIELD 7.35
(B GRRV-11650)
GPC 35.00
STONE 7.65

NEWFIELD 7.35

ABO 10.00 .
MYCO 10.00
YATES 10

( 11650-12025)

FEDERAL

UTU-76262

24

ufgl
N

FEDERAL 12-20-9-19, SEC 20-T9S-19E.

COMMINGLED PLAT FOR MESAVERDE AND GASQO
WASATCH, UNITA BASIN, UTAH

b0
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o . e - Page 1 of ]

~ Tony Sharp

From: David Smith

Sent:  Thursday, October 26, 2006 6:53 AM

To: Tony Shamp

.Subject: FW: Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19

Only Stone left. Wilt jump on them when the sun comes up.
David

p-4

Pmm Kelly Donohoue [manlho kdonohoue@newﬁeld oom]
Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2006 3:43 PM

To: David Smith

Subject: RE: Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19

Newfield has no objection to the commingling the Wasatch and Mesaverde formations in the Fed 12-20-8-19 well
- and waives the 15 day period for objection.

KLD

Kelly Donohoue, CPL

Division Landman ~ Development
Newfield Rocky Mountains, Inc.
1401 17th Street, Suite 1000
Denver, CO 80220

303-382-4494

k wf e d

From Davld Smllh [mallto dsmiﬂm@gascoenergy oom] .

Sant: Wednesday, October 25, 2006 8:31 AM

To: Kelly Donohoue

Subject: Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19 "~

Kelly, as discussed by telephone yesterday, attached is the Sundry Notice relating to the commingling of the
Wasatch and Mesaverde formations in the Fed 12-20-9-19 well. Gasco requests that Newfield, as an interested
party, waive the 15 period for objection to this operation. You indicated that this wauld not be a problem so
please send me an email indicating Newfield's waiver as soon a possible. Thank you!

David Smith

Devid R. Smith

Land Maneger

Gasco Energy, inc.

8 inverness Drive East
Suite 100

Englewood, CO 80112
Tel. 303.996.1812

Fex. 303.483.0011
dsmith@gascoenergy.com

10/27/2006

-
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Tony Sharp

From: David Smith

Sent:  Friday, October 27, 2006 9:35 AM

To: Tony Sharp

Subject: STONE! Commingling. Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19

—amith@gascoenergycom

From: Davis, Kent [mailto:DavisKS@StoneEnergy.com]
Sent: Friday, October 27, 2006 9:22 AM

To: David Smith

Cc: Ekington, Scott

Subject: RE: Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19

David - Stone Energy Corporation has no objection to the commingling of the Federal 12-20-8-19 well.
Thanks.

Kent S. Davis

Denver Land Manager
Stone Energy Corporation
950 17th Street, #2600
Denver, CO 80202

{303) 685-8033 - Direct
(303) 685-8000 - Main
{303) 208-4075 - Fax
davisks@@stoneenergy.com

From: David Smith [mailto:dsmith@gascoenergy.com]
Sent: Thursday, October 26, 2006 8:34 AM

To: Davis, Kent

Subject: Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19

Kent, ?ﬁ
I sent this to Alan Wild yesterday hoping to get it approved..
~ I know you've been out of town and appreciate anything you can do to get it back to me.

""';‘Gaswco intends to complete and commingle the Wasach and Mesaverde formations in the Fed 12-20-9-19 well

located in Uintah County, Utah.

As Stone has an interest in this well, Gasco requests Stone Energy Corp.'s waiver of the 15 day comment period.
Yates and Newfield have already waived the 15 day period and if you will return email me with an indication of
Stone’s walver, we can proceed with this operation which is currently scheduled for next week.

Thanks
David

Devid R. Smith

Land Manager

Gasco Energy, Inc. »
8 inverness Drive Egst
Sulte 100

Englewood, CO 80112
Tel 303.996.1812

Fax. 303.483.0011

dam th@gascoenargy.com

10/27/2006
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OCT 24 2006 4:15PM HP LASERJET 3200 p.d

GASGO
Energy Inc

Fax

1w . Ernest Camal pem  David Smith

GASCO Enargy, ine.
& Irvemass Drve Eas!
Sulte 100

Englewood, CO 80112
Phone: (303) 483-0044
FAX: (303) 483-0011

Phanes 505.748.4362 Dt
PAX: 5057484872 pages: 3 Including caver
ma:  Federal 12-20-9-19 Well oc: '
Commingling Walver of
Ohjection

Erneat,

Thanks for your time on the telephone today. Attacked i a eopy of the Sandry Notice
relating o the Commingling otﬂwMumrdouquﬂfornﬁmlnthFadml 12-
30-9-10 Well Iocated in Ulntah County, Utsh, Gasco Produetion Company requesia that
Vates Petreloum Corporation waive ts vights to the 15 dsy period to ebject to thb

operation.

You bave agvesd b&hvubdly.Willyn'lmadmwledp that waiver by signing
belew s returning » copy by eolefex to the (303) 483-8011.

Thank yeu — David Smith

Ymmwolmcmpnnﬁw'bym-__g‘ﬂf% [ P x,‘./m

5 homzed
Tris message Is for the Jole use of the Jetanded raciplntis) aad iy contaln contigensial :16 privinged x.rom:wmn&nm

Twviesw; wae, disclosure or dlswibetian i pralibtied. I you art ot the (ntanded reciplent, pieass contect
aitroy all roples of ths erigingi message.

-8
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RASCOCY | news netease

For Immediate Release on Wednesday, September 20, 2006

GAasco ENERGY ACQUIRES WORKING INTEREST PARTNER BREK ENERGY

IN STOCK-FOR=-STOCK MERGER
TRANSACTION ACCRETIVE TO NA V,' CONSOLIDATES
UINTA BASIN AND GREEN RIVER BASIN LEASEHOLD

DENVER — (PR Newswire) — September 20, 2008 — Gasco Energy, Inc. (AMEX: GSX) today announced that it
has agreed to purchase Brek Energy Corporation. (OTCBB: BREK) for equity consideration of approximately 11
million shares of Gasco Energy common stock valued at approximately $30 million based on the closing price of
Gasco's common stock on September 20, 2006. The acquisition is expected to simplify Gasco's acreage
portfolio by absorbing a working interest partner that previously owned approximately 14% working interest in
Gasco’s undeveloped acreage in both Utah and Wyoming. The acquisition will increase Gasco's reserves,
production, and net leasehold acreage in Utah's Uinta Basin and in Wyoming's Green River Basin where the
two companies share leasehold acreage in common. Accordingly, the acquisition is in line with Gasco's long-
standing strategy of aggregating its acreage position in its core areas, which it has done over the years in a
series of transactions with other operators and industry partners. :

As a result of the acquisition, Gasco will acquire approximately 17,085 net acres in the Uinta Basin, increasing
its average working interest in its Uinta Basin properties to 74% from its current average working interest of
approximately 60%, and approximately 12,485 net acres in Wyoming's Green River Basin, increasing its
average working interest In its Green River Basin properties to 63% from its current average working interest of
approximately 49%. Pro forma for the transaction, Gasco will own or control 124,281 gross acres (91,565 net)
In the Uinta Basin and 92,212 gross acres (57,718 net) in the Green River Basin.

Brek's year-end 2005 proved reserves totaled 5.8 billion cubic feet of natural gas equivalents (Bcfs), of which
approximately 98% Is natural gas. Proven undeveioped reserves represented approximately 80% of the total. At
December 31, 2005, Gasco’s proven reserves were 76.7 Bcle.

Current net production included in the transaction is estimated at 170 thousand cubic feet of natural gas per
day. Gasco will not incur any additional overhead expenses as a result of the acquisition.

Afier giving effect to the transaction, Gasco expects to operate 52 gross wells and own over 100 miles of
gathering system, plus a natural gas processing plant. In addition, afler giving effect to the transaction, Gasco
will own or control 216,493 gross and 149,283 net leasehold acres in its core areas of operations. Gasco
currently has seven rigs under contract, four of which are operating in the Riverbend Project, one of which is
operating in Wyoming. Gasco expects delivery of an additional rig in Utah in January 2007 and a second rig in
Wyoming in September 2006.

The company does not expect the 2006 CAPEX budget of $80 million to be revised materially to accormmodate
the higher working interest in the remainder of the 20086 drilling program. Brek has frequently opted to go non-
consent on previous Gasco wells in which it received an authority for expenditure, aliowing Gasco to participata
with a higher working interest. The increased interest Gasco is bearing is offset by an estimated fewer gross
wells of 28 to 30 versus the previously announced gross waell target of 32 wells. Fewer gross wells are being
drifled due to previously announced delays in obtaining the fourth rig and mechanical breakdowns earlier in the
year of one of the existing rigs. Gasco’s previously announced target of 15 net wells for 2006 remains
unchanged.
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Management Comment

Commenting on the acquisition, Gasco’s CEO and Prasident, Mark Erickson said: “The acquisition is consistent
with our strategy of consolidating acreage in our core areas from other operators and industry partners. The
transaction is accretive on a net asset value per-share basis and increases our existing acreage position by
approximately 20%. The transaction is a natural fit and one that we have targeted for some time. The
undeveloped acreage represents the bulk of the value in this transaction. Since the properties are a direct
overiay to the leases we already hold in Utah and Wyoming, we are in a unique position to evaluate Brek. The
resource and reserve potential of Brek's properties are nearly propartionate to our own properties. increased
ownership furthers our conviction and dedication to best developing the Uinta Basin while reinforcing our
bullishness on the Rockies as one of the most important areas for future development of natural gas.”

The boards of directors of Gasco and Brek have each approved the terms of the transaction, which s expected
to close near the end of 2008. The complstion of the acquisition is subject to the approval of the stockholders of
Brek and the completion of a distribution of certain subsidiaries of Brek to its stockholders. Under ths terms of
the transaction, a wholly owned subsidiary of Gasco will merge with and into Brek. As a result of the merger,
Brek will become a wholly owned subsidiary of Gasco and each stockholder of Brek will recelve a number of
shares of stock of Gasca equal to 11 million divided by the total number of shares of common stock of Brek
outstanding on the date of the merger, calculated on a fully diluted basis. As part of the transaction, the -
directors of Brek, who collectively own approximately 24% of Brek’s outstanding common stock, have entered
into an agreement to vote their shares in favor of the transaction. In addition, Brek's President and CEO, who
owns approximately 18% of the outstanding common stock of Brek, has agreed to deposit 550,000 shares of
Gasco common stock acquired in the transaction in escrow to satisfy any claims with respect to breaches of
representations and warranties of Brek,

Prior to the consummation of the merger, Brek Is required to distribute its ownership of Vallenar Energy Corp.,
which owns oil and gas properties in Texas that are non-core to Gasco's operating strategy, together with other
non-core assets. The distribution of such assets is a condition to the consummation of the merger and is
subject to the satisfaction of regulatory approvals. JPMorgan served as advisor to Gasco in the transaction.

t n . '
Gasco Energy, Inc. is a Denver-based natural gas and oit exploitation and development company that focuses
on natural-gas-rich prospects in the Rocky Mountain area of the United States. The Company currently is active
in the Uinta Basin in Utah and controls acreage in the Greater Green River Basin of Wyoming. To leam more,

visit www.gascoenergy.com.
Investor Notice

Gasco and Brek will file a joint proxy statement/prospectus and other documents with the Securities and

Exchange Commission In relation to this transaction. investors and security hoiders are urged to read carefulty

these documents when they become available because they will contain important information regarding Gasco, :
Brek and the merger. A definitive joint proxy statement/prospectus will be sent to security holders of Brek J
seeking their approval of the transactions contemplated by the merger agreement. The approval of the security :
holders of Gasco is not required to consummate the merger. Investors and security hoklers may obtain a free

copy of the joint proxy statement/prospectus {(when it is available) and other documents containing information

about Gasco and Brek, without charge, at the SEC's website at www.sec.gov. Copies of the joint proxy

statement/prospectus and the SEC filings that will be incorporated by reference in the joint proxy

statement/prospecius may also be obtained free of charge by directing a request to the respective companies

as follows: information regarding Gasco can be obtained by contacting its investor relations department at 303-

483-00440r by accessing its websits at www.gascoenergy.com, and information regarding Brek can be obtained

by contacting its investor relations department at 866-472-7987 or by accessing its website at

www.brekensrgy.com.

Gasco, Brek and their directors, executive officers and certain other persons may be deemed to be participants
in the solicitation of proxies from Brek's stockholders in connection with the proposed transactions. Information
regarding such persons and a description of their direct and indirect inferests, by security holdings or otherwise,
will be contained in the joint proxy statement/prospectus and other relevant materials filed with the SEC.
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This document shall not constitute an offer to sell or the solicitation of an offer to buy any securities, nor shall
there be any sale of securities in any jurisdiction in which such offer, solicitation or sale would be uniawful prior
to registration or qualification under the securities laws of any such jurisdiction. No offering of securities shall be
made except by means of a prospectus meeting the requirements of the Securities Act of 1933, as amended.

Forward-locking statements
Certain statements set forth in this press release relate to management's future plans, objectives and

expectations. Such statements are forward-looking within the meanings of Section 27A of the Securities Act of
1933, as amanded, and Section 21E of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as amended. All statements other
than statements of historical facts included in this press releass, including, without limitation, statements -
regarding the Company’s future financial position, potential resources, business strategy, budgets, projected
costs and pians and objactives of management for future operations, are forward-looking statements. In
addition, forward—looldng statements generally can be identified by the use of forward-locking terminology such
as "may,” ‘will,” “expect,” “intend,” "project,” “estimate,” “anticipate,” “believe," or “continue” or the negative
thereof or similar terminology. Although any forward-looking statements contained in this press release are to
the knowledge or in the judgment of the officers and directors of the Company, believed to be reasonable, there
can be no assurances that any of these expectations will prove correct or that any of the actions that are
planned will be taken. Forward-looking statements involve known and unknown risks and uncertainties that may
cause the Company's actual performance and financial results in future periods to differ materially from any
projection, estimate or forecasted result. Some of the key factors that may cause actual results to vary from
those the Company expects include inherant unceriainties in interpreting engineering and reserve or production
data; operating hazards; delays or cancellations of drilling operations because of weather and other natural and
economic forces; fluctuations in ol and natural gas prices in response to changes in supply; competition from
other oompanies with greater resources; environmental and other govemment regulations; defects in titie to
properties; increases in the Company’s cost of borrowing or inability or unavailability of capital resources to fund
capital expenditures; and other risks described under *Risk Factors” in item 1. of the Company's 2005 Form 10-
K filed with the Securities and Exchange Commission on March 3, 20086.

Contact for Gasco Energy, Inc.: Investar Relations: 303-483-0044
-30-
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Energy Inc

8 Inverness Drive East
Suite 100

Englewood, CO 80112
Phone: (303) 483-0044
FAX: (303) 483-0011
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DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

This message is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential and
privileged information. Any unauthorized review: use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. if
you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply fax and destroy all copies
of the original message.

- GASCO Energy, In¢.- -~ -~



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-75090
6. IF INDIAN. ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
) o 7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bgf depiheiesalar plugg 3 N / A
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form fcf & 3
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
"
o werL [ GAS WELL OTHER FEDERAL 12.20.9.19
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER.
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 4304736093
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
8 INVERNESS DRIVE E,STE, .., ENGLEWOOD e CO . 80112 (303) 483-0044 RIVERBEND
4. LOCATION OF WELL
rooTaces AT surrace: 1837' FNL X 846' FWL county: UINTAH
QTR/QTR. SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SWNW 20 9S 19E S STATE:
UTAH
1. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT O O O
(Submit in Duplicate) [ Atercasine [/] FracTure TREAT [J sioeTRAcK TO REPAIR WELL
Approximate date work will start: [] casinGrepar [] w~ewconsTRUCTION [] TemPoRARILY ABANDON
11/1/2006 [ cHANGE To PREVIOUS PLANS [C] oreraToR cHANGE [] rusinGRePaR
[ cHanceTUBING D PLUG AND ABANDON ] ventorFare
[[] suBSEQUENT REPORT [J cHance weLL namE [] rueeack [] warer pisposaL
(Submit Original Form Only)
[ cHancE weLL sTATUS [C] PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [] waTeRr sHuT-OFF
Date of work completion:
COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS [ T]  RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE O omer:
[] conver weLL TYPe RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to complete all productive intervals in the Mesaverde and Wasatch formations, and to commingle production
from these intervals. Following the final fracture stimulation, a Completion Report containing the perforation and stimulation
specifics for each zone completed will be submitted. If required, the method used to account for and to allocate production
from each pool so commingled will be by individual interval hydrocarbon pore volume calculation.

Gasco Production Company has provided the owners of all contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the pools to
be commingled with a copy of this application, and has requested that they waive their right to the 15-day period of objection
per UDOGM Rule 649-3-22(3). Copies of emails or faxes from these owners, verifying their waivers, are attached. Additionally,
Gasco has acquired Brek Energy Corp., and herewith waives its right to objection. Gasco therefore respectfully requests that
the Division accept this application, with attachments, in lieu of the required affidavit with regard to notification of the
aforementioned owners.

Attachments:

1. Exhibit showing the location of all wells on, and the lease owners of, contiguous oil and gas lease or drlllmg units overlymg
the subject pools. : ;
2. Copies of waiver-of-objection emails from offset lease owners (Newfield, Stone, Yates etal).
3. News release regarding Gasco acquisition of Brek Energy Comp. (9/20/2006)

NamE pLease priny_Anthony W. Sharp mme Senior Engineer

SIGNATURE M e 10/27/2006

s 7

(This space for State use only) \_/
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OCT 3 0 2006

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING
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UTU-75090 NW/4
UTU-76033 GPC 76.25
BREK 8.75
STONE 7.65
GPC 75.00 NEWFIELD 7.35
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Tony Sharp

From: David Smith

Sent:  Thursday, October 26, 2006 6:53 AM

To: Tony Sharp

Subject: FW: Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19

Tony
Only Stone left. Will jump on them when the sun comes up.
David

From: Kelly Donohoue [mailto:kdonohoue@newfield.com]
Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2006 3:43 PM

To: David Smith

Subject: RE: Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19

Newfield has no objection to the commingling the Wasatch and Mesaverde formations in the Fed 12-20-9-19 well
and waives the 15 day period for objection.

KLD

Kelly Donohoue, CPL

Division Landman - Development
Newfield Rocky Mountains, Inc.
1401 17th Street, Suite 1000
Denver, CO 80220

303-382-4494
kdonohoue@newfield.com

From: David Smith [mailto:dsmith@gascoenergy.com) ‘

Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2006 8:31 AM

To: Kelly Donohoue

Subject: Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19 -

Kelly, as discussed by telephone yesterday, attached is the Sundry Notice relating to the commingling of the
Wasatch and Mesaverde formations in the Fed 12-20-9-19 well. Gasco requests that Newfield, as an interested
party, waive the 15 period for objection to this operation. You indicated that this would not be a problem so
please send me an email indicating Newfield's waiver as soon a possible. Thank you!

David Smith

David R. Smith

Land Manager

Gasco Energy, Inc.

8 Inverness Drive East
Suite 100

Englewood, CO 80112
Tel. 303.996.1812

Fax. 303.483.0011
dsmith@gascoenergy.com

10/27/2006
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Tony Sharp

From: David Smith

Sent:  Friday, October 27, 2006 9:35 AM

To: Tony Sharp

Subject: STONE! Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19

—dsmith@gascoenergy.com

From: Davis, Kent [mailto:DavisKS@StoneEnergy.com]
Sent: Friday, October 27, 2006 9:22 AM

To: David Smith

Cc: Elkington, Scott

Subject: RE: Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19

David — Stone Energy Corporation has no objection to the commingling of the Federal 12-20-9-19 well.
Thanks.

Kent S. Davis

Denver Land Manager
Stone Energy Corporation
950 17th Street, #2600
Denver, CO 80202

(303) 685-8033 - Direct
(303) 685-8000 - Main
(303) 296-4075 - Fax
davisks@stoneenergy.com

From: ISavid Smith [mailto:dsmith@gascoenergy.com]
Sent: Thursday, October 26, 2006 8:34 AM

To: Davis, Kent

Subject: Commingling Sundry, Fed12-20-9-19

Kent, &
| sent this to Alan Wild yesterday hoping to get it approved.
| know you've been out of town and appreciate anything you can do to get it back to me.

“Gasco intends to complete and commingle the Wasach and Mesaverde formations in the Fed 12-20-9-19 well
located in Uintah County, Utah.
As Stone has an interest in this well, Gasco requests Stone Energy Corp.'s waiver of the 15 day comment period.
Yates and Newfield have already waived the 15 day period and if you will return email me with an indication of
Stone’s waiver, we can proceed with this operation which is currently scheduled for next week.

Thanks
David

David R. Smith

Land Manager

Gasco Energy, Inc.

8 Inverness Drive East
Suite 100

Englewood, CO 80112
Tel. 303.996.1812

Fax. 303.483.0011
dsmith@gascoenergy.com

10/27/2006
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GASCO Energy, inc.
8 Invemess Drive East
Sulte 100

Englewood, CO 80112
Phone: (303) 483-0044
FAX: (303) 483-0011

GASCO
Energy Inc

Fax

To: Ernest Carrol From Davld Smith

Phone: 506.746.4362 Date
pages: 3 including cover

FAX: 505,748.4572
pe:  Federal 12-20-9-19 Well cc:
Commingling Waiver of
QObjection

Ernost,

Thanks for your time on the telephone today, Attached is a copy of the Sundry Naotice
relating to the Commingling of the Mesaverde and Wasatch formations in the Federal 12-
20-9-19 Well located in Uintah County, Utah. Gasco Production Company requests that
Yates Petrolcum Corporation waive its rights to the 15 day period to object to this

operation.

You have agreed to this verbally. Will you please ackmowledpe that waiver by signing
below and returning a copy by telefax to the (303) 483-0011.

Thank you — David Smith

Yates Petroleum Corporation by JMQ‘—‘% &m‘ én/m

jviieged information, Any wnauthorzed

This message Is for the sole use of the intended reciplent(s) and may contaln confidential end pr
the sender by reply fax and

review; use, dizclasure or distribution Is prohibited. f you are not the intended reciplent, please contact
destroy all coples of the original message.



HAsto@ l NEWS RELEASE

For Immediate Release on Wednesday, September 20, 2006

GAsco ENERGY ACQUIRES WORKING INTEREST PARTNER BREK ENERGY

IN STOCK-FOR-STOCK MERGER
TRANSACTION ACCRETIVE TO NA V; CONSOLIDATES
UINTA BASIN AND GREEN RIVER BASIN LEASEHOLD

DENVER - (PR Newswire) — September 20, 2006 — Gasco Energy, Inc. (AMEX: GSX) today announced that it
has agreed to purchase Brek Energy Corporation. (OTCBB: BREK) for equity consideration of approximately 11
million shares of Gasco Energy common stock valued at approximately $30 million based on the closing price of
Gasco’s common stock on September 20, 2006. The acquisition is expected to simplify Gasco’s acreage
portfolio by absorbing a working interest partner that previously owned approximately 14% working interest in
Gasco's undeveloped acreage in both Utah and Wyoming. The acquisition will increase Gasco’s reserves,
production, and net leasehold acreage in Utah’s Uinta Basin and in Wyoming’s Green River Basin where the
two companies share leasehold acreage in common. Accordingly, the acquisition is in line with Gasco’s long-
standing strategy of aggregating its acreage position in its core areas, which it has done over the yearsin a
series of transactions with other operators and industry partners.

As a result of the acquisition, Gasco will acquire approximately 17,095 net acres in the Uinta Basin, increasing
its average working interest in its Uinta Basin properties to 74% from its current average working interest of
approximately 60%, and approximately 12,495 net acres in Wyoming’s Green River Basin, increasing its
average working interest in its Green River Basin properties to 63% from its current average working interest of
approximately 49%. Pro forma for the transaction, Gasco will own or control 124,281 gross acres (91,565 net)
in the Uinta Basin and 92,212 gross acres (57,718 net) in the Green River Basin.

Brek’s year-end 2005 proved reserves totaled 5.8 billion cubic feet of natural gas equivalents (Bcfe), of which
approximately 98% is natural gas. Proven undeveloped reserves represented approximately 80% of the total. At
December 31, 2005, Gasco’s proven reserves were 76.7 Bcfe.

Current net production included in the transaction is estimated at 170 thousand cubic feet of natural gas per
day. Gasco will not incur any additional overhead expenses as a result of the acquisition.

After giving effect to the transaction, Gasco expects to operate 52 gross wells and own over 100 miles of
gathering system, plus a natural gas processing plant. In addition, after giving effect to the transaction, Gasco
will own or control 216,493 gross and 149,283 net leasehold acres in its core areas of operations. Gasco
currently has seven rigs under contract, four of which are operating in the Riverbend Project, one of which is
operating in Wyoming. Gasco expects delivery of an additional rig in Utah in January 2007 and a second rig in
Wyoming in September 2006.

The company does not expect the 2006 CAPEX budget of $80 million to be revised materially to accommodate
the higher working interest in the remainder of the 2006 drilling program. Brek has frequently opted to go non-
consent on previous Gasco wells in which it received an authority for expenditure, allowing Gasco to participate
with a higher working interest. The increased interest Gasco is bearing is offset by an estimated fewer gross
wells of 28 to 30 versus the previously announced gross well target of 32 wells. Fewer gross wells are being
drilled due to previously announced delays in obtaining the fourth rig and mechanical breakdowns earlier in the
year of one of the existing rigs. Gasco’s previously announced target of 15 net wells for 2006 remains
unchanged.



Management Comment

Commenting on the acquisition, Gasco's CEO and President, Mark Erickson said: “The acquisition is consistent
with our strategy of consolidating acreage in our core areas from other operators and industry partners. The
transaction is accretive on a net asset value per-share basis and increases our existing acreage position by
approximately 20%. The transaction is a natural fit and one that we have targeted for some time. The
undeveloped acreage represents the bulk of the value in this transaction. Since the properties are a direct
overlay to the leases we already hold in Utah and Wyoming, we are in a unique position to evaluate Brek. The
resource and reserve potential of Brek’s properties are nearly proportionate to our own properties. Increased
ownership furthers our conviction and dedication to best developing the Uinta Basin while reinforcing our
bullishness on the Rockies as one of the most important areas for future development of natural gas.”

The boards of directors of Gasco and Brek have each approved the terms of the transaction, which is expected
to close near the end of 2006. The completion of the acquisition is subject to the approval of the stockholders of
Brek and the completion of a distribution of certain subsidiaries of Brek to its stockholders. Under the terms of
the transaction, a wholly owned subsidiary of Gasco will merge with and into Brek. As a result of the merger,
Brek will become a wholly owned subsidiary of Gasco and each stockholder of Brek will receive a number of
shares of stock of Gasco equal to 11 million divided by the total number of shares of common stock of Brek
outstanding on the date of the merger, calculated on a fully diluted basis. As part of the transaction, the
directors of Brek, who collectively own approximately 24% of Brek’s outstanding common stock, have entered
into an agreement to vote their shares in favor of the transaction. In addition, Brek's President and CEO, who
owns approximately 18% of the outstanding common stock of Brek, has agreed to deposit 550,000 shares of
Gasco common stock acquired in the transaction in escrow to satisfy any claims with respect to breaches of
representations and warranties of Brek.

Prior to the consummation of the merger, Brek is required to distribute its ownership of Vallenar Energy Corp.,
which owns oil and gas properties in Texas that are non-core to Gasco’s operating strategy, together with other
non-core assets. The distribution of such assets is a condition to the consummation of the merger and is
subject to the satisfaction of regulatory approvals. JPMorgan served as advisor to Gasco in the transaction.

About Gasco Energy
Gasco Energy, Inc. is a Denver-based natural gas and oil exploitation and development company that focuses

on natural-gas-rich prospects in the Rocky Mountain area of the United States. The Company currently is active
in the Uinta Basin in Utah and controls acreage in the Greater Green River Basin of Wyoming. To learn more,
visit www.gascoenergy.com.

Investor Notice

Gasco and Brek will file a joint proxy statement/prospectus and other documents with the Securities and
Exchange Commission in relation to this transaction. Investors and security holders are urged to read carefully
these documents when they become available because they will contain important information regarding Gasco,
Brek and the merger. A definitive joint proxy statement/prospectus will be sent to security holders of Brek
seeking their approval of the transactions contemplated by the merger agreement. The approval of the security
holders of Gasco is not required to consummate the merger. Investors and security holders may obtain a free
copy of the joint proxy statement/prospectus (when it is available) and other documents containing information
about Gasco and Brek, without charge, at the SEC's website at www.sec.gov. Copies of the joint proxy
statement/prospectus and the SEC filings that will be incorporated by reference in the joint proxy
statement/prospectus may also be obtained free of charge by directing a request to the respective companies
as follows: Information regarding Gasco can be obtained by contacting its investor relations department at 303-
483-00440r by accessing its website at www.gascoenergy.com, and information regarding Brek can be obtained
by contacting its investor relations department at 866-472-7987 or by accessing its website at
www.brekenergy.com.

Gasco, Brek and their directors, executive officers and certain other persons may be deemed to be participants
in the solicitation of proxies from Brek's stockholders in connection with the proposed transactions. Information
regarding such persons and a description of their direct and indirect interests, by security holdings or otherwise,
will be contained in the joint proxy statement/prospectus and other relevant materials filed with the SEC.
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This document shall not constitute an offer to sell or the solicitation of an offer to buy any securities, nor shall
there be any sale of securities in any jurisdiction in which such offer, solicitation or sale would be unlawful prior
to registration or qualification under the securities laws of any such jurisdiction. No offering of securities shall be
made except by means of a prospectus meeting the requirements of the Securities Act of 1933, as amended.

Forward-looking statements

Certain statements set forth in this press release relate to management’s future plans, objectives and
expectations. Such statements are forward-looking within the meanings of Section 27A of the Securities Act of
1933, as amended, and Section 21E of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as amended. All statements other
than statements of historical facts included in this press release, including, without limitation, statements
regarding the Company'’s future financial position, potential resources, business strategy, budgets, projected
costs and plans and objectives of management for future operations, are forward-looking statements. In
addition, forward-looking statements generally can be identified by the use of forward-looking terminology such
as “may,” “will,” “expect,” “intend,” “project,” “estimate,” “anticipate,” “believe,” or “continue” or the negative
thereof or similar terminology. Although any forward-looking statements contained in this press release are to
the knowledge or in the judgment of the officers and directors of the Company, believed to be reasonable, there
can be no assurances that any of these expectations will prove correct or that any of the actions that are
planned will be taken. Forward-looking statements involve known and unknown risks and uncertainties that may
cause the Company's actual performance and financial results in future periods to differ materially from any
projection, estimate or forecasted result. Some of the key factors that may cause actual results to vary from
those the Company expects include inherent uncertainties in interpreting engineering and reserve or production
data; operating hazards; delays or cancellations of drilling operations because of weather and other natural and
economic forces; fluctuations in oil and natural gas prices in response to changes in supply; competition from
other companies with greater resources; environmental and other government regulations; defects in title to
properties; increases in the Company’s cost of borrowing or inability or unavailability of capital resources to fund
capital expenditures; and other risks described under “Risk Factors” in ltem 1. of the Company’s 2005 Form 10-
K fited with the Securities and Exchange Commission on March 3, 2006.

Contact for Gasco Energy, Inc.: Investor Relations: 303-483-0044
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CCRFIDENTIAL

Creco PROPOCTIN CO —rp9s 0)9E S5-26
Federal 12-20-9-19 Y3—0y9—- 3697>

1" Mobe Completion 1% stage — Black Hawk / Spring Canyon, Aberdeen,
Kennilworth

4/12/06 Rig up SLB and run CCL/ Gama Ray / Bond log. Shows good bond to
surface.

4/14/06 Rig up B&C Quick test and pressure test CSG to 9500 psi. Test good.

4/20/06 Rig up SLB wireline and RIH w/ guns for Stage #1 Spring Canyon /
Aberdeen, Kennilworth and perf @ 12,477-80, 12,588-91, 12,724-28, 3
spf. Rig up SLB frac crew (Grand Junction, Kevin). Broke down perfs @
5712 psi @ 4.6 bpm. ISIP 4950. FG .83. Calc 20 holes open / 30.
Hybrid fraced Stg 1 w/ 153,515# 20-40 Optiprop, using 3145 bbls YF
125, WF 118, and YF 120 gel. ISIP 5040. FG .84. Was never able to get
to full rate of designed job. Early in job, was able to get to 37 — 39 bpm
(supposed to be 40 bpm). As job progressed, rate continued to fall off.
Had trouble w/ several frac pumps (1 wouldn’t go into lock up, down all
job). Finished job w/ rate @ 29 — 30 bpm. Blender intermittently would
fall off and lose discharge pressure. Flushed wellbore w/ 184.1 bbls, @
29 — 30 bpm. ISIP 5040. FG .84. Opened well up to FB @ 2:45 PM on
10/64” ck w/ 5000 SICP. Will temperature log perfs to see if all 3
benches were fraced properly and lower rates. (SCE)

4/21/06 Well flowing this AM @ 3300 psi on a 14/64 ck. Made 1036 bbls in 10 '
hrs. TR 1036, BLWTR 2109. Rig up SLB wireline and RIH w/ plug and
guns for stage #2. Set 9 % k FTFP @ 12,178” w/ 3800 psi on well bore.
Perf stage # 2 Blackhawk / Desert / Grassy @ 12,054-57’, 12,156-60".
Broke down perfs @ 6176 psi @ 10 BPM. ISIP 4330. FG .80. Calc shots
open 18 open out of / 21. Hybrid frac stage #2 w/ 10,000 # 20/40 SB
Excel and 65,268 # 20/40 Opti Prop sand, using 2300 bbls YF and WF
118 gel. Flushed well w/ 177.8 bbls @ 30 bpm. ISIP 4840. FG .84. Turn
well over to flow back @ 11:35 am @ 4700 psi on a 10/64 ck. Close well
in W/ 4100 psi and RIH w/ plug and guns for Stage #3 Lower Mesaverde
set FTFP #2 @ 11,574’ pressure test plug to 8500 psi and hold 1000 psi
over while shooting PERFS @ 11,237-40°, 11,307-10°, 11,326-29’,
11,546-50°. Pressure fell on 11,326-29 guns when shot. Pump 1 BPM to
maintain psi until wireline was out of hole. Break down perfs @ 4790 @ 4

R ECE,VE BPM. ISIP 4450. FG .83. Calc shots open 22 out of 39. Hybrid frac stage
D #3 w/ 100630# of 20/40 SB Excel sand using 2600 bbls of YF and

NOV 1 5 2006 WF118 gel. Flushed well w/ 165 bbls @ 45 BPM. ISIP 4475, FG .83.
Turn well over to flowback @ 6:30 pm @ 4500 psi on a 10/64 ck. (CR /

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MNiNSCE)



4/22/06

4/23/06

5/17/06

5/18/06

5/19/06

8/11/06
8/31/06

Well flowing this AM @ 2900 FCP on 14/64” ck. Made 1567 bbls in 16
Y% hrs. TR 2603. BLWTR 2841. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stg 4 —
Lower Mesaverde. Set FTFP #3 @ 11138’. Psi test plug to 8500 psi. At
7900 psi, bottom gun inadvertently fired. Off depth shots were @ 10958 —
62’ (coincidently, where we were going to shoot “perf only” holes).
POOH. RIH w/ redressed gun and perforated f/ 11012 — 15°, 11099 -
102°, 11116 — 20°, 3 spf. Perfs f7 10978 — 80’ were cancelled due to extra
holes. SLB determined that Owens sub only 10k psi rated, in a 15K gun
system. Redesigned frac to x-link gel, instead of Hybrid frac. Pumped
into perfs @ 1.5 bpm to maintain positive psi on FTFP for a total of 56
bbls. Fd 3925 SICP. Pumped into perfs (no break dn) @ 4370 @ 6.1
bpm. Calc 25 holes open / 42. Gel fraced Stg 4 w/ 81,235# (into
formation) 20-40 SB Excel, using 1528 bbls YF 118 gel. Screened out
to 8500 psi, leaving 10,500# of 5 ppg sd in csg. Got 70 bbls flush away.
Opened well up to FB @ 4:50 PM on 12/64” ck w/ 3400 SICP. (SCE and
CR)

RIH w/plug and guns to perf Stage 5 — Mesaverde. Set FTFP #4 @
10892°. Pressure tested to 5400 psi (1900 #s over differential).
Perforated 10816-20 & 10873-77. Maintained .4 - .5 bpm to keep 4300
psi on FTFP. Broke down perfs @ 6000 @ 6.0 bpm and 7233 @ 10 bpm
ISIP 4300 FG .84. Calc 14 out of 21 shots open. Hybrid fraced well
161,028# of 20-40 SB Excel using 3352 bbls of WF & YF 118 gel.
Flushed well with 159.3 bbls. Opened well to FB @ 10:15 am on a 10/64”
ck w/5000 SICP.

MORU service unit, rig up pump and tank. Pump 90 bbls to control well.
NDFT and NUBOP, tally pipe and pick up 3 % bit, POBS, X-nipple. RIH
w/ 215 jts leaving EOT @ 6800°. Return well down sales and shut down
for night. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 10,503 CCC § 10,503

Well flowing this AM @ 1600 psi. RIH w/ 129 jts (344 total) and tag up
@ 10,894°, pick up swivel and break circ. Drill out plugs and clean out to
PBTD @ 12,854. Circulate bottoms up and POOH w/ 69 jts laying down.
Rig up swab and broach tbg, return well to sales for night and shut down.
(Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC § 7529 CCC § 18,032

Well flowing this AM @ 1400 psi. Land tbg @ 10,656 w/ 336 jts, drop
ball and pump bit off @ 1000 psi. return well to sales and RDMO. (Rick
w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 1841 CCC § 19,873

Update late costs: DC 45,093 CCC
Update cost : 825,412 CCC § 890,378



10/24/06

10/25/06

10/26/06

MORU service unit, lay pump and lines. Pump 40 bbis down tbg and
NDWH and NU BOP. Put csg to sales and start out of hole w/ tbg tallying,
POOH w/ 48 jts and SDFD leaving well flowing to sales. (Rick w/
Premier / CR) DC $ 5303 CCC $ 895,681

Well flowing this AM @ 800 psi. Finish POOH w/ 288 jts and BHA. Pick
up 3 % smith bit and 4 2 scrapper. RIH w/ 342 jts to 10,834’. POOH w/
240 jts laying down, return well to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier /
CR) DC § 7881 CCC $ 903,562

Well flowing this AM @ 200 psi. pump 60 bbls down tbg and finish
POOH w/ 102 jts and BHA. ND BOP and NU frac tree, pressure test tree
to 9500 psi. RDMO location. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 6394 CCC $
909,956

Completion — 2" (and final) Mobe — Dark Canyon and Upper Mesaverde

11/8/06

11/9/06

11/10/06

MIRU SLB Wireline (Jason). Perforate “Perf Onlys” f/ 10580 — 92°,
10634 — 54°, 11150 - 60°, 11186 — 96°, 12307 — 14’, 3 spf. MIRU SLB
frac (Shawn Moon).

RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 6 — Upper Mesaverde. Set 10K CBP
@ 10315°. Loaded csg w/ 54 bbls. Max allowable ok to 8500 psi. Tested
plug to 5300 psi, ok. Perforated f/ 9888 — 91°, 10029’ —32°, 10296 —
300°, 3 spf. Broke dn perfs and SD to check ISIP, @ 4200 psi, ok.
Proceed w/ Prepad. ISIP 4080. FG .85. Slick water fraced w/ 28,900#
20-40 reg sd, and 18,400# 20-40 SB Excel, using 2125 bbls 10# and WF
115 Slickwater gel. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 7 — Upper
Mesaverde — Dark Canyon. Set FTFP #2 (@ 9534°. Psi tested plug to
6500 psi, ok. Bled off and held 4000. Perforated f/ 9334 — 37°, 9427 —
30°, 9513 -17’, 3 spf. Pumped 86 bbls, while perforating, to hold plug
shut. Pumped into formation @ 3870 @ 4.5 bpm (No break). ISIP 3640.
FG .83. Calc 22 holes open / 30. Hybrid fraced w/ 30,000# 20-40 reg
white sd, and 19,700# 20-40 SB Excel, using 2188 bbls 10# Slickwater.
Flushed well w/ 137.3 bbls. ISIP 3800. FG .84. Opened well up to FB @
2:00 PM, on 12/64” ck w/ 3750 SICP. SWI @ 6:00 AM to perforate.
Well flowing back w/ 2400 FCP on 16/64” ck. Made 1742 bbls in 16 hrs.
TR 1742. BWLTR 2656. (SCE) DC $207,330 CCC $1,117,286

Well flowing this AM w/ 750 FCP on 20/64” ck. Made 516 bbls in 14
hrs. TR 2258. BLWTR 2141. MORU service unit, set kill plug @ 6514°.
Bleed down well and NDFT and NU BOP. Pick up 3 % smith bit, POBS,
X-nipple and RIH w/ tbg tallying off pipe racks. Tag kill plug @ 6514° w/
206 jts, pick up swivel and break circ. Drill out plug and turn well over to



11/11/06

11/12/06

11/14/06

11/15/06

flow back for clean up. ( Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 13,055 CCC $
1,130,341

Well flowing this AM @ 700 psi. RIH w/ 135 jts and tag FTFP #1 @

9541°. Break circ and drill out remainder of plugs. RIH w/ tbg and tag
PBTD @ 12,828 and POOH w/ 11 jts. Turn well down sales line and
SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 16,313 CCC § 1,146,654

Well flowing @ 1100 psi this AM. Open well up and POOH w/ 10 jts,
land well @ 12,207" w/ 384 jts. Broach tbg and ND BOP and NUWH.
Drop ball and pump off bit. Rig up swab and recover 70 bbls in 10 runs.
FFL @ 2800° well not flowing. Turn tbg to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/
Premier / CR) DC $ 6288 CCC § 1,152,942

Well dead this AM. Rig up swab and make 20 runs and recover 108 bbls.
Tbg still not flowing. Leave tgb to sales and SDFD (Rick w/ Premier /
CR) DC $6317 CCC $ 1,159,259

Blow down tbg and rig up swab. Make 7 runs and recover 42 bbls. Well
started flowing, unload well to pit and turn down sales. Well flowing @
1450 psi on a 16 choke. To windy to rig down, SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier /
CR) DC $ 5454 CCC $ 1,164,713



Forin 3160-4 1 UNITED STATES ~on FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Foramamr . OMB NO. 1004-0137
i el N .
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT T ‘“ Expires: November 30, 2000
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 3. Lease Serial No.
UTU-75090
1a. Type of Well 0 oit wen T4 Gas O Dry  Other 6. Hindian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: E New D Work Over D Deepen D Plug Back D Diff. Resvr. NA
Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.
2N fO AL
- Name of Operator 8. Lease Name and Well No.
(iusu; Production Company Federal 12-20-9-19
. Ad . Phone No. finclude ar
3 ress 3a one No. (include area code) 5 APl Well No.
8 Inverness Drive Last Suite 100. Englewood. Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 13-047-36093
4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements) * : -
10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory
Atsurface IS37 FNE & 840 FW]. SW NW Parictic Beneh
11. Sec., T, R., M., or Block and
At top prod. interval reported below Same Survey or Area___See 20-T9S-RI9F
12, County or Parish 13. State
At total depth Same Uintah Uiah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached Ib.ﬁle Completeh 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*
. e D&A Ready to Prod. i} |
329/ 8 Gl 4835 K
10:07:05 13:29/06 047506 4808 G - 4835 KB
18. Total Depth: MD 12925 19. Plug Back TD.:. MD 12828 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set: MD NA
TVD 12925 TVD 12828 TVD NA
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22 Was well B No D Yes (Submit copy)
Was DST run? No [} Yes (Submit copy)

BHC: PEGR: HRLL: ML: CBL Directional

ﬂ No [ ves (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry Vol.

Hole Size | Size/Grade | Wt (#/f) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Depth Type of Cement (BBL) Cement Top* Amount Pulled
F7 172" §E3 38 48# ) 219 180 sx of Class G Cire to Surl’
12 14" 18 5:/8 )-55 324 0 3502 60U sx of Class G Cire to Surf’
778" 4 i12P110 13 54 0 12872 500 sx of Hilift Surf - CBL

1845 sx ol 50-50

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) |Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) | Packer Set (MD)
2 3/8" 12207
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A) Blackhawk 12054 12728 See Attached
By Mcsaverde 9513 11.329
) Iark Canvon 9334 9430
D)
E)
27 Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Ftc.
Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
See Attached
28. Production - Interval A
Date First |Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced [Date Tested Production |BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity
04:25/06] 04:29:06] 24 —> 0 1,333 600 Flowing
Choke Tbe Press. [Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size Flwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API
12/64" Isi 2410 | —» 0 1.333 600 Producing from A & B
28a.
Date First  JTest Hours Test Ol Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas 'ttbw\w
Produced Date Tested Production [BBL. MCF BBL Corr. AP] Grawvity
—> FEB 2 § 7007
Choke Tbe. Press  |Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Ol Gravity Well Status b
Size Flwg Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Corr. API
A > DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING

(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)



28b.

Date First |Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced [Date Tested Production  |BBL MCF BBL Corr. API
11/14/06| 11/17/06 24 —> 0 455 190 Flowing
Choke Tog. Press.  |Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
16/64"[S'  1016] 0 > 0 455 190 Producing from A, B & C
28c. Production - Interval E
Date First |Test Hours Test QOil Gas Water Ot Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced [Date Tested Production  |BBL MCF BBL Corr. API
> Flowing
Choke Tbg. Press Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio
si —_—>
29. Disposition of Gas (Sold. used for fuel vented, etc.)
Sold

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem

tests, including depth interval tested. cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures

and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents. etc. Name | Top
Meas. Depth

Wasatch 5.498 9,327
Dark Canyon 9,327 9,435
Mesaverde 9435) 11,660
Blackhawk 11,996 Well was td'd within the Blackhawk @ 12,925
32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):
33. Circle enclosed attachments:

1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 fuli set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey

5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please p,,y,// Beverly Walker Title Engineering Tech

Signature -(//7)//(“;/,,.(/( / // é/lé’{ Date 2/13/2007
Vi pd _——

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

o US. GPO: 1999-573-624



27. Perforation Record

Federal 12-20-9-19
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

Perforated Interval Size 0. Hole| Perf. Status
12724-28'; 12588-91; 12477-80; 12307-14; 12156-60"; 12054-57' 0.38 72 Open
11546-50"; 11326-29"; 11307-10"; 1 1237-40%; 11186-96; 11150-60; 111 16-20'; 11099-102"; 11012-15";
10958-62'; 10873-77"; 10816-20"; 10634-54; 10580-92; 10296-300; 10029-32; 9888-91;9513-17 0.38 303 Open
9427-30; 9334-37 0.38 18 Open

28. Acid Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Eic (continued)

Depth Interval

Amount and Type of Material

12,477 - 12,728

153,515# 20-40 Optiprop, using 3145 bbls of YF 125, WF 118 and YF 120 gel

12,054 - 12,160

10,0004 of 20/40 SB Excel and 65,268# of 20/40 Opti Prop sand, using 2300 bbls YF and WF 118 gel

11,237 - 11,550

100,630# of 20/40 SB Excel sand using 2600 bbls of YF and WF118 gel

10,958- 11,120

81,235#0f 20-40 SB Excel, using 1528 bbls YF 118 gel

10,816 - 10,877

161,028# of 20-40 SB Excel using 3352 bbls of WF & YF 118 gel

9,888 - 10,300

28,900# 20-40 reg sd, and 18,400# 20-40 SB Excel, using 2125 bbls 10# and WF 115 Slickwater gel

9,334-9,517

30,0004 20-40 reg white sd, and 19,7004 20-40 SB Excel, using 2188 bbls 10# Slickwater

RECEIVED
FEB 2 6 2007

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



»

FORM APPROVED

Form3160-5 UNITED STATES
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0135
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires Jnovember 30, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-75090
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
7. 1f Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side
1. Type of Well NA
) oit wen X) Gas Weit ] Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator Federal 12-20-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 APl Well No.
3a.  Address 3b.  Phone No. {include area code) 43-047-36093
8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Foorage. Sec.. T.. R. M.. or Survey Description) Riverbend
1837' FNL & 846’ FWL t1. County or Parish. State
, ; . QL .
SW NW of Section 20-T9S-R19E Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

[ water Shut-0fr
) well Integrity
X3 other Stte Security

[] Production (Start/Resume)
[ Reclamation
) Recomplete

D Deepen
D Fracture Treat
D New Construction

[ Acidize
D Alter Casing
L_:I Casing Repair

() Notice of Intent

(3} Subsequent Report

D Plug and Abandon D Temporarily Abandon

D Change Plans

[J convert 1o njection [C] water Disposal

[2) Final Abandonment Notice 2 Plug Back

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
1f the proposal is to decpen directionally or recomplete honzontally . give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the mvolved operations  If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval. a Fonm 3160-4 shall be fled once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements. induding reclamation. have been completed. and the operator has
determined that the site isready for final inspection

Please find attached a copy of the site security diagram for this lease.

14, Thereby certify that the foregomg s true and correct

Name (Printed/Tvped) Tule

Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Date O/P/C)’/

" D /»74 W

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE -

Approved by Title Date
-('-o-n(;il lc:n—s-ol-' ;p—p:o'val. ifany, are attached Approval of this notice does nat warrant or | Offjce

certify that the applicant holds legal or equiable ttle to those nghts in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicam to conduct operations thereon

1 Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
false. fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

{Instructions on reverse)
RECENTD
MAR 1 £ 2007
DIV. OF OIL, GAZ = ~MING
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This lease is subject to the
Site Security Plan for GASCO
Production Company The
Plan 15 localed at
GASCO Production Company
8 Inverness Dnve Eas\
Suite 100
Englewood, CO 80112-5625

LEGEND
S - Sales Valve
O - Drain Valve
I - Inlet Valve
O - Overflow
B - Blowdown
V - Vent

POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING PRODUCTION/BLOWDOWN

Valves
D -
S

0
B

Valves
]

S -

. |
POSITION OF VAL
. \L

POSITION OF VALVES AND USE OF SEALS DURING SALES

3
(S
8

Line Purpose Position Seal Installed
Drain Closed Yes
Sates Closed . Yes,

_ Intet Open No
Overflow Open/Closed | ~No
Blowdown Open/Closed | No

Line Purpose Position | Seal Installed
N ,Q’@“ o Clos}ed . ‘Leiv -
Sses | Open | Mo
et | Closed _Yes
_ Overflow Closed . Yes,
. Biowdown Closed | _Yes

VES AND USE OF SEALS DURING WATER DRAIN

73
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e
©
['¥]
=
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2
o
[T
/
o § /
NS
<
,/
/’,

BuyYs & ASSOCIATES, INC.
ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULTANTS

| vawes ePurpose |  Position | Sealinstalied.
% D | Open
s - Closed

|0 | Owdow [ Coseo

(... B :__ Blowdown Closed

GASCO Production Company
Federal 12-20-9-19
SWI/NW Sec. 20, Twp. 9S, Rge. 19E
Uintah County, Utah
October 2006




RECEIVED

+ CONFIDENTIL At 03

Gasco Production Company DIV, OF OIL, GAS & MINING
Federal 12-20-9-19
SW NW of Section 20-T9S-R19E
Uintah County Utah,
043-047-36093

1* Mobe Completion 1" stage — Black Hawk / Spring Canyon, Aberdeen,
Kennilworth

4/12/06 Rig up SLB and run CCL/ Gama Ray / Bond log. Shows good bond to
surface.

4/14/06 Rig up B&C Quick test and pressure test CSG to 9500 psi. Test good.

4/20/06 Rig up SLB wireline and RIH w/ guns for Stage #1 Spring Canyon /

Aberdeen, Kennilworth and perf @ 12,477-80, 12,588-91, 12,724-28, 3
spf. Rig up SLB frac crew (Grand Junction, Kevin). Broke down perfs @
5712 psi @ 4.6 bpm. ISIP 4950. FG .83. Calc 20 holes open / 30.
Hybrid fraced Stg 1 w/ 153,515# 20-40 Optiprop, using 3145 bbls YF
125, WF 118, and YF 120 gel. ISIP 5040. FG .84. Was never able to get
to full rate of designed job. Early in job, was able to get to 37 — 39 bpm
(supposed to be 40 bpm). As job progressed, rate continued to fall off.
Had trouble w/ several frac pumps (1 wouldn’t go into lock up, down all
job). Finished job w/ rate @ 29 — 30 bpm. Blender intermittently would
fall off and lose discharge pressure. Flushed wellbore w/ 184.1 bbls, @
29 — 30 bpm. ISIP 5040. FG .84. Opened well up to FB @ 2:45 PM on
10/64” ck w/ 5000 SICP. Will temperature log perfs to see if all 3
benches were fraced properly and lower rates. (SCE)

4/21/06 Well flowing this AM @ 3300 psi on a 14/64 ck. Made 1036 bbls in 10 %2
hrs. TR 1036, BLWTR 2109. Rig up SLB wireline and RIH w/ plug and
guns for stage #2. Set 9 % k FTFP @ 12,178 w/ 3800 psi on well bore.
Perf stage # 2 Blackhawk / Desert / Grassy @ 12,054-57°, 12,156-60".
Broke down perfs @ 6176 psi @ 10 BPM. ISIP 4330. FG .80. Calc shots
open 18 open out of / 21. Hybrid frac stage #2 w/ 10,000 # 20/40 SB
Excel and 65,268 # 20/40 Opti Prop sand, using 2300 bbls YF and WF
118 gel. Flushed well w/ 177.8 bbls @ 30 bpm. ISIP 4840. FG .84. Turn
well over to flow back @ 11:35 am @ 4700 psi on a 10/64 ck. Close well
in W/ 4100 psi and RIH w/ plug and guns for Stage #3 Lower Mesaverde
set FTFP #2 @ 11,574 pressure test plug to 8500 psi and hold 1000 psi
over while shooting PERFS @ 11,237-40°, 11,307-10°, 11,326-29’,
11,546-50°. Pressure fell on 11,326-29” guns when shot. Pump 1 BPM to
maintain psi until wireline was out of hole. Break down perfs @ 4790 @ 4
BPM. ISIP 4450. FG .83. Calc shots open 22 out of 39. Hybrid frac stage



4/22/06

4/23/06

Em—

#3 w/ 100630# of 20/40 SB Excel sand using 2600 bbls of YF and
WF118 gel. Flushed well w/ 165 bbls @ 45 BPM. ISIP 4475, FG .83.
Turn well over to flowback @ 6:30 pm @ 4500 psi on a 10/64 ck. (CR /
SCE)

Well flowing this AM @ 2900 FCP on 14/64” ck. Made 1567 bbls in 16
1 hrs. TR 2603. BLWTR 2841. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stg 4 —
Lower Mesaverde. Set FTFP #3 @ 11138’. Psi test plug to 8500 psi. At
7900 psi, bottom gun inadvertently fired. Off depth shots were @ 10958 —
62’ (coincidently, where we were going to shoot “perf only” holes).
POOH. RIH w/ redressed gun and perforated f/ 11012 — 15°, 11099 -
102°, 11116 — 20°, 3 spf. Perfs f7 10978 — 80 were cancelled due to extra
holes. SLB determined that Owens sub only 10k psi rated, in a 15K gun
system. Redesigned frac to x-link gel, instead of Hybrid frac. Pumped
into perfs @ 1.5 bpm to maintain positive psi on FTFP for a total of 56
bbls. Fd 3925 SICP. Pumped into perfs (no break dn) @ 4370 @ 6.1
bpm. Calc 25 holes open / 42. Gel fraced Stg 4 w/ 81,235# (into
formation) 20-40 SB Excel, using 1528 bbls YF 118 gel. Screened out
to 8500 psi, leaving 10,500# of 5 ppg sd in csg. Got 70 bbls flush away.
Opened well up to FB @ 4:50 PM on 12/64” ck w/ 3400 SICP. (SCE and
CR)

RIH w/plug and guns to perf Stage 5 — Mesaverde. Set FTFP #4 @
10892°. Pressure tested to 5400 psi (1900 #s over differential).
Perforated 10816-20 & 10873-77. Maintained .4 - .5 bpm to keep 4300
psi on FTFP. Broke down perfs @ 6000 @ 6.0 bpm and 7233 @ 10 bpm
ISIP 4300 FG .84. Calc 14 out of 21 shots open. Hybrid fraced well
161,028# of 20-40 SB Excel using 3352 bbls of WF & YF 118 gel.
Flushed well with 159.3 bbls. Opened well to FB @ 10:15 am on a 10/64”
ck w/5000 SICP.

5/17/06

5/18/06

5/19/06

MORU service unit, rig up pump and tank. Pump 90 bbls to control well.
NDFT and NUBOP, tally pipe and pick up 3 % bit, POBS, X-nipple. RIH
w/ 215 jts leaving EOT @ 6800°. Return well down sales and shut down
for night. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 10,503 CCC § 10,503

Well flowing this AM @ 1600 psi. RIH w/ 129 jts (344 total) and tag up
@ 10,894, pick up swivel and break circ. Drill out plugs and clean out to
PBTD @ 12,854. Circulate bottoms up and POOH w/ 69 jts laying down.
Rig up swab and broach tbg, return well to sales for night and shut down.
(Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 7529 CCC §$ 18,032

Well flowing this AM @ 1400 psi. Land tbg @ 10,656 w/ 336 jts, drop
ball and pump bit off @ 1000 psi. return well to sales and RDMO. (Rick
w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 1841 CCC $ 19,873



8/11/06
8/31/06

o e

10/24/06

10/25/06

10/26/06

pa—

Update late costs: DC 45,093 CCC
Update cost : 825,412 CCC § 890,378

MORU service unit, lay pump and lines. Pump 40 bbls down tbg and
NDWH and NU BOP. Put csg to sales and start out of hole w/ tbg tallying.
POOH w/ 48 jts and SDFD leaving well flowing to sales. (Rick w/
Premier / CR) DC $ 5303 CCC § 895,681

Well flowing this AM @ 800 psi. Finish POOH w/ 288 jts and BHA. Pick
up 3 % smith bit and 4 % scrapper. RIH w/ 342 jts to 10,834’. POOH w/
240 jts laying down, return well to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier /
CR) DC $ 7881 CCC §$ 903,562

Well flowing this AM @ 200 psi. pump 60 bbls down tbg and finish
POOH w/ 102 jts and BHA. ND BOP and NU frac tree, pressure test tree
to 9500 psi. RDMO location. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 6394 CCC $
909,956

Completion — 2" (and final) Mobe — Dark Canyon and Upper Mesaverde

11/8/06

11/9/06

MIRU SLB Wireline (Jason). Perforate “Perf Onlys” f/ 10580 — 92°,
10634 — 54°, 11150 — 60°, 11186 ~ 96°, 12307 — 14°, 3 spf. MIRU SLB
frac (Shawn Moon).

RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 6 — Upper Mesaverde. Set 10K CBP
@ 10315°. Loaded csg w/ 54 bbls. Max allowable ok to 8500 psi. Tested
plug to 5300 psi, ok. Perforated f/ 9888 — 917, 10029° — 32°, 10296 -
300°, 3 spf. Broke dn perfs and SD to check ISIP, @ 4200 psi, ok.
Proceed w/ Prepad. ISIP 4080. FG .85. Slick water fraced w/ 28,900#
20-40 reg sd, and 18,400# 20-40 SB Excel, using 2125 bbls 10# and WF
115 Slickwater gel. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 7 — Upper
Mesaverde — Dark Canyon. Set FTFP #2 @ 9534°. Psi tested plug to
6500 psi, ok. Bled off and held 4000. Perforated f/ 9334 — 37°, 9427 —
30°, 9513 - 17, 3 spf. Pumped 86 bbls, while perforating, to hold plug
shut. Pumped into formation @ 3870 @ 4.5 bpm (No break). ISIP 3640.
FG .83. Calc 22 holes open / 30. Hybrid fraced w/ 30,000# 20-40 reg
white sd, and 19,700# 20-40 SB Excel, using 2188 bbls 10# Slickwater.
Flushed well w/ 137.3 bbls. ISIP 3800. FG .84. Opened well up to FB @
2:00 PM, on 12/64” ck w/ 3750 SICP. SWI @ 6:00 AM to perforate.
Well flowing back w/ 2400 FCP on 16/64” ck. Made 1742 bbls in 16 hrs.
TR 1742. BWLTR 2656. (SCE) DC $207,330 CCC $1,117,286



11/10/06

11/11/06

11/12/06

11/14/06

11/15/06

4/23/07

5/4/07

5/5/07

Well flowing this AM w/ 750 FCP on 20/64” ck. Made 516 bbls in 14
hrs. TR 2258. BLWTR 2141. MORU service unit, set kill plug @ 6514’.
Bleed down well and NDFT and NU BOP. Pick up 3 % smith bit, POBS,
X-nipple and RIH w/ tbg tallying off pipe racks. Tag kill plug @ 6514° w/
206 jts, pick up swivel and break circ. Drill out plug and turn well over to
flow back for clean up. ( Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC §$ 13,055 CCC $
1,130,341

Well flowing this AM @ 700 psi. RIH w/ 135 jts and tag FTFP #1 @
9541°. Break circ and drill out remainder of plugs. RIH w/ tbg and tag
PBTD @ 12,828’ and POOH w/ 11 jts. Turn well down sales line and
SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 16,313 CCC § 1,146,654

Well flowing @ 1100 psi this AM. Open well up and POOH w/ 10 jts,
land well @ 12,207> w/ 384 jts. Broach tbg and ND BOP and NUWH.
Drop ball and pump off bit. Rig up swab and recover 70 bbls in 10 runs.
FFL @ 2800° well not flowing. Turn tbg to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/
Premier / CR) DC $ 6288 CCC § 1,152,942

Well dead this AM. Rig up swab and make 20 runs and recover 108 bbls.
Tbg still not flowing. Leave tgb to sales and SDFD (Rick w/ Premier /
CR) DC $6317 CCC$ 1,159,259

Blow down tbg and rig up swab. Make 7 runs and recover 42 bbls. Well
started flowing, unload well to pit and turn down sales. Well flowing @
1450 psi on a 16 choke. To windy to rig down, SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier /
CR) DC $ 5454 CCC$ 1,164,713

Update late costs. DC 26206 CC $ 1,190,919

Road rig to location and spot in. To windy to rig up SDFD due to weather.
DC §$ 2225 CC $ 1,166,938

Open tbg to sales and flowed for 1 }; hrs. unload well to tank and drop
plunger and cycle 2 times. Move off location. DC $ 6265 CC $ 1,173,203



Sundry Nunber: 50328 API Well Nunber: 43047360930000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UT0-75090 '

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 12-20-9-19
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047360930000
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH
4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH
1837 FNL 0846 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
Qtr/Qtr: SWNW Section: 20 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING |:| CASING REPAIR
] NOTICE OF INTENT [ chanee To PREVIOUS PLANS ] chance Tusine O] chance weLt nave
Approximate date work will start:
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS |:| CONVERT WELL TYPE
1/ SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: D DEEPEN D FRACTURE TREAT / NEW CONSTRUCTION
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D SPUD REPORT D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE |:| RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:
D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL |:| TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE D WATER DISPOSAL
D DRILLING REPORT D D |:|
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER: I

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Gasco Production Company replaced a 400 bbl water tank on this Accepted by the

location. Utah Division of
Qil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
April 24, 2014

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER | TITLE

Lindsey J. Cooke 303 996-1834 Production Tech
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 4/24/2014

RECEI VED: Apr. 24, 2014




Division of Qil, Gas and Mining

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:

Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265

7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500

Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237

303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV
WELL INFORMATION:

Well Name Sec [TWN [RNG [API Entity Mineral |Surface |[Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:

1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:

1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A

3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015

4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016

5. UICS on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A

6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None

7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A
NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:

1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUR0027842

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A

3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUR0027845

DATA ENTRY:

1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on:

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on:

3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on:

4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on:

5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on:
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on:

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

SUR0035619 -FCB

1/22/2016
1/22/2016
1/22/2016
N/A
1/22/2016
N/A

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016

COMMENTS:

1/22/2016



From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

Well Name Section |TWN |RNG |API Number |Entity |Mineral |Surface |Type |Status
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S | 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S |190E |4304752522 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304752538 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S |190E |4304752544 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304752545 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304752546 Federal |Federal OW |APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753026 Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 421-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753027 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753029 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 431-29-9-19 29 090S |190E [4304753030 | Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753031 | Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 414-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753070 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753073 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753076 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304753078 Federal |Federal (GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S | 190E 4304753079 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753080 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753133 Federal |Federal GW |APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754479 State State |GW_|APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754480 State State |GW |APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754481 State State |GW_|APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754482 State State |GW |APD
State 323-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754483 State State |GW |APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754529 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304754541 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754542 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754543 State State |GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304753012 |19650 Federal |Federal | GW |DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301333098 (15941 |Federal |Federal (GW |OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S |190E 4304736915 {16556 |Fee Fee GW _|OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738573 17201 |Federal Federal |(GW |OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304739777 |18344 |[Federal Federal GW |OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S |190E 4304739800 [17202 |Federal Federal GW |OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S |150E 4301332391 13787 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S |170E 4301332447 114033 |State State |GW_|P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S |150E 4301332475 |14417 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S |170E 4301332560 [14726 |Federal |Federal | GW |P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S |160E 4301332611 14439 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 124-11-17 4 110S |170E|4301332674 |15537 |Federal |Federal GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S |170E|4301332676 |15242 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332679 14033 |[Federal |Federal  GW |P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S |150E 4301332685 [16082 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S |170E 4301332730 |15243 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332773 |15370 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 110S [170E 4301332778 14802 Federal |Federal | GW [P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 1110S |160E 4301332888 15098 |State State |GW P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S [170E|4301333081 |15714 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S |170E 4301333087 ;15807 [Federal |Federal \GW |P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S [170E|4301333099 ;15920 Federal |[Federal GW [P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S |140E 4301333437 |16919 Federal |Federal | GW |P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 i 24 110S !140E 4301333443 /16367 Federal [Federal GW |P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S |180E 4304730129 16266 |State State |OW [P
RBU 5-11D 11 100S |180E 4304730409 9005 |Federal Federal OW P |
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S | 180E 4304730624 (9030 |Federal |Federal |OW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 6-2D 2 100S [180E 4304731190 |7075 |State |State |OW |P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S |190E 4304731200 |6155 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S |180E 4304731280 |16267 |State  |State |OW |P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731352 |16268 [Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731357 |7053 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 8-10D 10 100S |180E 4304731364 (4955 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731539 |9965 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S [180E 4304731651 |10688 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 2-10D 10 100S |180E[4304731801 {10784 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S |180E [4304733600 |13213 [Federal |Federal  OW |P
RBU 3-12D 12 100S |180E [4304733739 |14492 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733741 14244 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S |190E|4304733750 |13174 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S |180E 4304733983 |13182 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S |[190E|4304734111 113441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304734168 |14150 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S | 190E 4304734169 |14140 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304734199 |13601 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304734201 |13641 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304734202 |13455 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S |170E [4304734286 |13492 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S |190E[4304734314 |14440 State  |State |GW |P
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 100S | 180E 4304734539 13491 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S |170E |4304734551 |13726 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S |190E 4304734607 113640 Federal |Federal |GW [P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 14304734608 [14151 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S |180E 4304734924 [14280 [Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304735343 14202 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735404 [14203 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S |190E[4304735405 {14928 |Federal |Federal GW |P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S |190E[4304735588 |14418 |State | Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304735606 |14441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304735614 |14442 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S |190E (4304735623 114640 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304735624 14419 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735732 14496 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S |190E|4304735733 14519 |Fee Fee |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S |180E 4304735808 |15592 |[Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 100S |190E 4304735844 14356 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304735845 |14639 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S |190E|4304735995 |14871 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304736093 |14976 |Federal |Federal |(GW |P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S |190E[4304736094 [16120 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736095 |14872 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304736113 |15096 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736219 |14738 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736220 (14763 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736233 |14764 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304736241 |14992 [State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S |180E (4304736242 |14716 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S |190E|4304736271 15884 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736336 |15086 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736368 |15605 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736442 |15715 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736600 14977 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304736719 |15186 Federal Federal | GW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 125 090S |180E 4304736727 !15475 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736739 |15476 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736740 |15213 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S |190E|4304736771 |15355 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S | 180E 4304736772 |15338 [Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S ' 190E (4304736817 15212 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S |190F 4304736913 |15187 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S |190E 4304736916 (17012 |Fee Fee |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304737115 |15011 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S |190E (4304737116 |16163 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190F 4304737117 |16275 |Federal [Federal |GW [P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180F 4304737132 |15087 |State  |State |GW [P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737338 15365 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304737611 [16311 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304737612 16051 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737613 (16052 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S (190E 4304737621 |16253 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S |190F [4304737622 |16264 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737630 |16557 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737631 15961 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737646 16023 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S '180F |4304737647 16121 |Federal [Federal GW |P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304737676 16254 State  |State |GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737677 |15806 |State  |State |GW |P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304738028 |16868 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738336 (16467 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304738337 16119 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738351 |16884 |Federal [Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738352 |16349 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S |180F 4304738353 16210 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738407 16236 |Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S |180F 4304738465 16558 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738469 |16449 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S |190E |4304738575 |16312 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S | 190F |4304738673 115832 |Fee Fee |GW [P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S |180E 4304738896 16792 Federal |Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S |190E 4304739170 |16309 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S '190E 4304739171 /16308 [State  |State |GW |P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S '190F [4304739172 [16310 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304739717 |17054 Federal |[Federal |GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739729 |17241 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739730 (17266 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S |180E |4304739773 (17013 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S |190E 4304740233 |17014 |[Federal Federal |GW [P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S |190E 14304751280 |18211 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304751281 |18210 |[Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190 4304752870 {19647 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304752872 |19648 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 ] 30 090S |190E 4304753011 |19649 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S |180F (4304753324 [19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753325 |19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S |180F |4304753326 19747 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304753327 |19747 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753328 '19783 [State  |State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S '170E[4301332677 |15144 |State  |State |GW S
RBU 4-11D 11 100S |180E 14304730718 |16269 |Federal |Federal (OW [S




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-11D 11 100S |180E |4304730826 116270 |[Federal |Federal OW |S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731192 16271 |Federal |Federal OW |S
STATE 2-32B 32 090S |190E 4304732221 |11371 State  |State |GW_|S
STATE 9-36A 36 090S |180E |4304732225 |11364 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S |190E 4304733581 |13249 |Federal |Federal |GW |S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733598 17838 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 16-26A - 26 090S |180E 4304733601 |12928 |Federal 'Federal | GW |S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S |190E 4304733653 13077 |[Federal Federal (GW |S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S |180E|4304734312 [16265 |[Federal |Federal OW 'S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304739776 (17149 Federal |Federal GW |S




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-76482

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

®. IFINDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WEL
Y owwew [J

GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT-
7979 E. Tufts Ave. crry Denver s1are CO 580237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTAGES AT sURFAce: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL county: Uintah

QTR/AQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 108 18E S STATE: y

TAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ TYPE OF ACTION
[ aciize [J oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

2] nNoTiCE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [ Arercasing

Approximate date work will start [[] casingrepar

4/16/2015

[] crance TueinG

[] suBseQUENTREPORT  |[T] cHaNce weLL NAME

(Submit Originat Form Only)

Date of work completion:

[C] converT weLL Type

[ cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS

[] cHance weLL sTaTUS
[C] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

[[] eracture TrReAT

[C] ~ewconsTRucTION

[/] oPeraTOR CHaNGE

[ Puucanp ABanDON

[ ruseack

[] ProDUCTION (STARTRESUME)

[J RecLAMATION OF WELL SITE

[C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] sibETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
[J TeEmPORARILY ABANDON
] rtueinc Repair

[J venrorFLare

[ warter bisposaL

] waTER sHuT-OFF

1 omer:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11
Denver CO 80237

303-996-1805 M i

Michael Decker, Exec. Vice President & COO

Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite,115
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805 -

Michael Decker, Exec. Vicd President & COO

RECEIVED
JUN 02 2015

DIV, QF OIL, GAS & MINING

APPROVED

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) LjLndsey C°°ks rme Engineering Tech
SIGNATURE ‘ ( ﬁl@/ oate 9/18/2015
(This space for State use only)
JAN 2 2 2016
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

| V. OlL GAS & MINING -
BYWM\&



Well Name

FEDERAL 332-30-9-19

WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19

FEDERAL 12-17-9-19

GATE CYN 31-21-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16

WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08

GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17
RYE PATCH FED 22-21

RYE PATCH FED 24-21

RBU 5-11D

FEDERAL 7-25A

RBU 6-2D

NGC 33-18)

RBU 13-2D

RBU 16-3D

RBU 10-11D

RBU 8-10D

RBU 15-3D

RBU 12-12D

RBU 2-10D

RBU 3-15D

RBU 3-12D

STATE 7-36A

FEDERAL 34-29
FEDERAL 24-7 #1

FEDERAL 23-29 #1

FED 24-20-9-19

FED 44-20-9-19

FED 23-21-9-19

FED 32-31-9-19

FED 42-29-9-19

PETES WASH 23-12 #1

STATE 4-32B

FED 14-18-2 #1

FED 43-24-3 #1

LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19

FED 11-21-9-19

FED 22-30-10-18

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

FED 11-22-9-19

FED 42-21-9-19

STATE 24-16-9-19

Section TWN
30 090S
29 1008
23 0908
26 0908
19 090S
17 090S
21 1108
32 1008
20 1108
17 1008
19 1108
32 1008
4 1108
32 1008
29 1008
16 1108
16 1008
29 1008
8 1108
16 1108
20 1008
20 1008
4 1108
22 1108
24 1108
11 1008
25 0908
2 1008
18 090S
2 1008
3 1008
11 1008
10 100S
3 1008
12 100S
10 1008
15 1008
12 1008
36 090S
29 0908
7 1008
29 090S
20 090S
20 090S
21 090S
31 090S
29 090S
12 1008
32 090S
18 1008
24 1008
22 0908
21 0908
30 1008
30 090S
22 090S
21 090S
16 090s

RNG
190E
170E
190E
180E
190E
190E
1S0E
170E
150E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
170E
150E
170E
170E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
140E
140E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
170E
190E
180E
170E
190E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E

API

4304753012
4301333098
4304736915
4304738573
4304739777
4304739800
4301332391
4301332447
4301332475
4301332560
4301332611
4301332619
4301332674
4301332676
4301332679
4301332685
4301332730
4301332773
4301332778
4301332888
4301333081
4301333087
4301333099
4301333437
4301333443
4304730409
4304730624
4304731190
4304731200
4304731280
4304731352
4304731357
4304731364
4304731539
4304731651
4304731801
4304733600
4304733739
4304733741
4304733750
4304733983
4304734111
4304734168
4304734169
4304734199
4304734201
4304734202
4304734286
4304734314
4304734539
4304734551
4304734607
4304734608
4304734924
4304735343
4304735404
4304735405
4304735588

Entity
19650
15941
16556
17201
18344
17202
13787
14033
14417
14726
14439
15649
15537
15242
14033
16082
15243
15370
14802
15098
15714
15807
15920
16919
16367
9005

9030

7075

6155

16267
16268
7053

4955

9965

10688
10784
13213
14492
14244
13174
13182
13441
14150
14140
13601
13641
13455
13492
14440
13491
13726
13640
14151
14280
14202
14203
14928
14418

Mineral
Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Surface Type

Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
ow
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW

Status

335532

e Mia- e - B - B - e~ Mia - Mie - Mia- Mo - M - e - Bl - M - B - Bia - Bin - Mie - M - Bhe - e~ M- B - Miet - B - e - e - Mia - M - B - ke - Mia - M- B - B - Bin - e - Mia - M - B - e - ke - M - M - Bin - Mia - Ml - M - Mk - ke - Ml -



FEDERAL 31-21-9-19
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19

LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19

DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18
STATE 12-32-9-19

FEDERAL 12-20-9-19
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19

DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18

SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19

21
29
31
31
22
14
22

36
32
20
20
30
26
36
36
36
36
36
31
31
31
31
25
19
25
30
25
19
25
30
22
14
36

1008
1008
090S
090S

090S
090S
0908
1008
100S

100S
100S
100S

0908

090S
090S

090S
090S
090S

190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
180E
190E
190E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
180E
190E

4304735606
4304735614
4304735623
4304735624
4304735732
4304735733
4304735808
4304735844
4304735845
4304735995
4304736093
4304736094
4304736095
4304736113
4304736219
4304736220
4304736233
4304736241
4304736242
4304736271
4304736336
4304736368
4304736442
4304736600
4304736719
4304736727
4304736739
4304736740
4304736771
4304736772
4304736817
4304736913
4304736916
4304737115
4304737116
4304737117
4304737132
4304737338
4304737611
4304737612
4304737613
4304737621
4304737622
4304737630
4304737631
4304737646
4304737647
4304737676
4304737677
4304738028
4304738336
4304738337
4304738351
4304738352
4304738353
4304738407
4304738465
4304738469
4304738575

14441
14442
14640
14419
14496
14519
15592
14356
14639
14871
14976
16120
14872
15096
14738
14763
14764
14992
14716
15884
15086
15605
15715
14977
15186
15475
15476
15213
15355
15338
15212
15187
17012
15011
16163
16275
15087
15365
16311
16051
16052
16253
16264
16557
15961
16023
16121
16254
15806
16868
16467
16119
16884
16349
16210
16236
16558
16449
16312

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
Federal
Federal
State

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
State
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Fee
Fee
State
Federal
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal

GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
Gw
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
GwW
GW
GW
GW
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LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18
STATE 21-32B

STATE 22-32A

STATE 21-32A

FEDERAL 11-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID)
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19

Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18

22
11
32
32
32
19
25
25
I

19
30
19
30
30
30
36
36
36
36

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36

WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17
SQUAW CROSSING U §
RBU 4-11D

RBU 2-11D

RBU 6-11D

STATE 2-32B

STATE 9-36A
FEDERAL 13-30B
STATE 13-36A
FEDERAL 16-26A
FEDERAL 31-29

RBU 1-10D

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19

32
2

11
11
11
32
36
30
36
26
29
10
18

090S
100S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
100S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
090S
0908
090S
100S
1008
100S
1008
1008
090S
0908
0908
090S
0908
090S
100S
090S

190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
170E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E
180E
180E
190E
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