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EOG Resources, Inc.

P.O. 1910
Vernal, UT 84078

July 15, 2004

Utah Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801 i
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

RE: APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
gy PET-lim-WABIHINIT-1-32

SE/NW, SEC. 32, T10S, R18E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH qg yg
LEASE NO.: UT ST ML
STATE OF UTAH LANDS

Enclosed please find the Application for Permit to Drill and associated attachments for
the referenced well.

Please address further communication regarding this matter (including approval) to:
Ed Trotter
P.O. Box 1910
Vernal, UT 84078
Phone: (435)789-4120
Fax: (435)789-1420

Sincere

Ed Trotte
Agetit

Attachments
EOG Resources, Inc.

RECE IVED
JUL16 2004

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

Pete's Wash Unit 1-32
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9 9
STATE OF UTAH FORM 3

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING AMENDEDREPORT D

(highlight changes)

APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILL
SINERALLEASEND 6 SUReFACE:

1A TYPE OF WORK DRILL2 REENTER O DEEPEN O 7 IF INDIAN,ALL OR TRIBE NAME:

B TYPE OF WELL: OIL D GAS OTHER SINGLEZONE MULTIPLEZONE O 8. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9 WELL NAMEand NOMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. STATE 1-32
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10, FIELOANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
P.O. BOX 1815 enY VERNAL STATE UT y, 84078 (435) 789-0790
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 1 11. QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,5924/2 x 34.Vol-Î Ñ MERIDIAN:

ATSURFACE: 2152'FNL,2067FWL Will -/ô9.4/ÿ¾

SENW 32 10S 18E S
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: SAME

14. DISTANCEIN MILESAND DIRECTIONFROM NEARES†TOWNOR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
UTAH

34.38 MILESSOUTHEAST OF MYTON,UTAH UINTAH
16. DISTANCETO NEARE$T PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRESINLEASE: 17 N JMBER OP ACRESASSIGNEOTOTHis WELL:

2067' 600
18. DISTANCETONEAREST WELL (DRILUNG.COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSEDDEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPUED FOR) ON THISLEASE (FEET)

SEE TOPO MAP C 11,700 JP-0921
21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER OF, RT, GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATEDATEMOAK WILLSTART: 28. ESTIMATEDDURATION:

5571.4' GRADED GROUND 8/15/2004 45 DAYS

24. PROPOSED CASINGAND CEMENTINGPROGRAM
SizE OF HOLE CASING812E, GRADE, ANDWEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY,YlELD,ANDSLURRY WEIGHT

17 1/2" 13 3/8" H40 48.0# 250 SEE 8 POINT PLAN

12 1/4" 9 5/8" J-55 36.0# 2,700 SEE 8 POINT PLAN

7 7/8" 4 1/2" P-110 11.6# 11,700 SEE 8 POINT PLAN

REGEIVED
JUI,16Pela

2s ATTACHMENTS gg
VERIFYTHE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHEDINACCORDANCEWITHTHEUTAHOILANDGASCONSERVATIONGENERALRULES:

WELLPLATOR MAP PREPARED BY UCENSED SURVEYOROR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILUNGPLAN

EVIDENCEOF DivlSION OF WATERRIGHTSAPPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 6, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

i

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) E Trotte TITLE Agent

SIGNATURE DATE 7/15/2004

(This space for State use only)

APPROVEDBYTHE STATE
OF UTAH DIVISIONOF

APINUMBERASSIGNED: APPROVAL:O¡LGA N MINING
DAT •

(11/2001) (See Instructions on
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00 2
From: Ed Bonner
To: Whitney,Diana
Date: 7/16/2004 4:10:23 PM
Subject: Leases and bonds

The following leases and bonds are OK

The Houston Exploration Company ML47063 Bond No. 104155043

BillBarrett Corporation ML48386 Bond No. LPM4138147

EOG Resources, Inc ML49054 Bond No. JP

00 2
From: Ed Bonner
To: Whitney,Diana
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Subject: Leases and bonds

The following leases and bonds are OK

The Houston Exploration Company ML47063 Bond No. 104155043

BillBarrett Corporation ML48386 Bond No. LPM4138147
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From: Ed Bonner
To: Whitney,Diana
Date: 7/16/2004 4:10:23 PM
Subject: Leases and bonds

The following leases and bonds are OK

The Houston Exploration Company ML47063 Bond No. 104155043

BillBarrett Corporation ML48386 Bond No. LPM4138147
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T10S, Ri8E, S.L.B.&M. EOG RESOURCES, INC.
Well location, STATE #1-32, located as shown in
the SE 1/4 NW 1/4 of Section 32, T10S, R18E,
S.L.B.&M. Uintoh County, Utah.

a L

SB9°5673"W
- 2623.35' (Meas.)

n
NS9 58'E 2640.00' (G.L.O.)

BASIS OF ELEVATION
1910 aus ce 1910 &oas ¢y
20' Hip, No 20' HI¢, N• BENCH MARK FLUK VABM LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTIONof semes of Stmes 32, T9S, R18E, S.LB.&M. TAKEN FROM THE CROW KNOLL,

QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTEQUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHICMAP) PUBLISHEDBY THE UNITEDSTATES
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR,GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID
ELEVATIONIS MARKEDAS BEING5244 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

S1M /1- J2 2
2067· Elex Ungraded Ground = 5572'

N
o

32 °
1910 &ass Cy
tas' usy, Two

. .Ples of Simes -a

o o - o

SCALE

CERT1FICA
THIS BS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE AB
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS ME OR UND
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAM
BESTOF MY KNOWLEDGEANDB ,

* * g

DOS
TiiS WEST5280.00' (G.Lo.) UmmH ENGINEERING & I.sAND MVEYING

85 SOUTH 200 EAST - V£RMål.'UTAH B40'/8
(435) 789-1017

LEGEND: SCALE DATESURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:
1" = 1000' 07-09-04 07-12-04L =

90° SYMBOL (NAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES

O = PROPOSED WELL HEAD· LATITUDE =
39°54'06.73" (39.901869) D.A. T.A. D.COX G.L.O. PLAT

A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE=
109°55'06.90" (109.918583)

BTHER

WARM
næEOG

RESOURCES,
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

STATE1-32
SE/NW, SEC. 32, T10S, RISE, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAB COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION DEPTH (KB)
Wasatch 4,121'
North Horn 6,304'
Dark Canyon 8,284'
KMV Price River 8,555'
KMV Price River Middle 9,629'
Bluecastle 9,937'
KMV Price River Lower 10,346'
KMV Castlegate 10,863'
KMV Blackhawk l1,108'
Sunnyside 11,373'
Kenilworth 11,650'

EST. TD: 11,700 Anticipated BHP 5100 PSI

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: 5000 PSIG BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:
RATING FACTOR

HOLE SIZE INTERVAL LENGTH H WEIGHT GRADE THREAD COLLAPSEBURST TENSILE
Option 1

17 ½" 0' - 250' 250' 13 3/8" 48.0# H-40 STC 770 PSI 1730 PSI 322,000#
12 1/4" 250' - 3200'+/- KB 3200' +/- 9 5/8" 36.0 # 1-55 ST&C 2020 PSI 3520 PSI 394,000#

7 7/8" 3200' - TD +/-KB l1,700' +/- 4 1/2" 11.6 # P-110 LT&C 7560 PSI 10,690 PSI 279,000#

All casingwill be new or inspected.

5. Float Eauipment:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Insert Baffle
Wooden wiper plug
Centralizers: 1 - 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints(4 total).

Intermediate Role Procedure (250'- 3200'):
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Cents.: 1-5' aboveshoe, top of jts.#2 and #3 then every 5* joint to surface. (15 total)

8 point plan-EOG
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Clinton DworsÑaState Pa

EIGHT POINT PLAN

STATE 1-32
SE/NW, SEC. 32, TIOS, R18E,S.L.B.&tM.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

Production Hole Procedure (3200'-TD'):
FS, 1joint of casing, FC, and balance of casing to surface. Run 11.6#, P-110 burst rating or equivalent
marker collars or short casing joints at ± 8,555' (Top of Price River) and ± 3,700' (400' above the
Wasatch) (alter depth if needed to avoid placing across any potentially- productive intervals).
Centralize 5' above shoe on joint #1, top of joint #2, then every 2nd joint to 400' above potentially
productiove zones as indicated on open hole logs. Thread lock FS, top and bottom of FC, and top of
2ndjOÎHÍ.

6. MUD PROGRAM

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'below GL):
Air - Air Water Mist

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'- 3200'):
Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

Production Hole Procedure (3200'-TD):
3200'- 5000' Water (circulatethrough reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

5000'- 8500' Close in mud system. "Mud up" with 6.0 pob Diammonium Phosphate (DAP). Drill
with DAP water, POLYPLUS for viscosityand hole cleaning,adding KLA-GARD B for
supplemental inhibition. Also sweep hole periodically w/ Durogel / LCM sweeps to
clean the hole and seal loss zones. Add additional LCM as hole dictates. Mud weight
and vis as needed, water loss - no control.

8500'- TD Discontinue KLA-GARD B. Utilize POLYPAC-R for fluid loss control. Maintain i
g.gg DAP. Do not mix caustic or lime. Maintain 7.5-8.5 pH. Weight up system and
add vis as hole conditions require. Run LCM sweep periodically to seal off loss zones or
more often as hole dictates. Water loss: 20 cc's maximum. Expect increasing gas shows
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7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:
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possible, a straight run blooie line will be used).

B. EOG Resources, Inc. requestsa variance to regulations requiring an automatic ignitor or
continuous pilot light on the blooie line. (Not required on aerated water system).
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To reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be 75' in length.
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

STATE 1-32
SE/NW, SEC.32, TIOS, RISE, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:
Logs: Open hole logs consisting of, Platform Express, Dipole Sonic and Sidewall cores (as needed) from TD

to intermediate casing.

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:
Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'Below GL)

Lead: 300 sks (100% excess volume) Class 'G' cementwith 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps D29
(cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ff./sk., 4.95 gps water.

Top Out: Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) in mix water, 15.8 ppg, 1.16 fts./sk.,
4.95 gps via 1" tubing set at 25' if needed.

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'- 3200'):

Lead: 270 sks: (50% excess volume) Class 'G' lead cement (coveragefrom 2200-0')
with 5% D44 (Salt), 12% D20 (Bentonite), 1% D79% (Extender), 0.25% D112
(Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D46 (Anti-Foamer) & 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes)
mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.91 ff/sk., 24.5 gps water.

Tail: 300 sks: (50% excessvolume)Class 'G' cement (coverage from 3200-2200') with
10% DS3 (Gypsum), 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes)mixed at
14.2 ppg, 1.61 ff/sk., 7.9 gps water.

Production Bole Procedure (3200' to TD)

Lead: 615 sks (30% excess)35:65 Poz G cement (coveragefrom 9500'-5900') w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite),
2% DI74 (Extender), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), 0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% D112 (Fluid Loss
Additive), 0.15% D13 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29 (cello flakes), mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.73 cu. ft./sk.,
9.06 gps water

Tail: 500 sks: (30% excess) 50:50 Poz G cement (coverage 9500'-TD) w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite),0.1%
D46 (Antifoam), 0.15% Dl3 (Retarder), 0.2% DI67 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65
(Dispersant), mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 cu. ft./sk., 5.9 gps water.

Actual cement volumes will be calculated based on open hole caliper logs + 5% excess.

10. ABNORMAls CONDITIONS:
Intermediate Hole (250'- 3200'):
Lost circulation below 1800' and minor amounts of gas may be present.

Production Hole (3200'-TD):
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ClintonDworshak - State 1-32 A.doc Pa

EIGHT POINT PLAN

STATE 1-32
SE/NW, SEC. 32, T10S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
Sloughingshales and key seat developmentare possible in the Wasatch Formation. CO2
contamination in the mud is possible in the Price River (Mesa Verde).

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicalssubjectto reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds
will be used, produced, stored,transported,or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.
Furthermore, no extremelyhazardoussubstances,as defined in 40 CFR 355, in thresholdplanning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored,transported,or disposedof in associationwith the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

STATE 1-32
SEINW, SEC. 32, T108, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION DEPTH (KB)
Wasatch 4,121'
North Horn 6,304'
Dark Canyon 8,284'
KMV Price River 8,555'
KMV Price River Middle 9,629'
Bluecastle 9,937'
KMV Price River Lower 10,346'
KMV Castlegate 10,863'
KMV Blackhawk 11,108'
Sunnyside 11,373'
Kenilworth 11,650'

EST. TD: 11,700 Anticipated BHP 5100 PSI

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: 5000 PSIG BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:
RATING FACTOR

HOLE SIZE INTERVAL LENGTH §Jgg WEIGHT GRADE THREAD COLLAPSE BURST TENSILE
Option 1

17 ½" 0' -250' 250' 13 3/8" 48.0# H-40 STC 770 PSI 1730 PSI 322,000#
12 1/4" 250'-2700'+/- KB 2700' +/- 9 5/8" 36.0 # J-55 ST&C 2020 PSI 3520 PSI 394,000#

7 7/8" 2700' - TD +/-KB 11,700' +/- 4 1/2" 11.6 # P-110 LT&C 7560 PSI 10,690 PSI 279,000#

Option 2
12 1/4" O'-2700'+/- KB 2300' +/- 9 5/8" 36.0 # J-55 ST&C 2020 PSI 3520 PSI 394,000#
7 7/8" 2700' - TD +/-KB 11,700' +/- 4 1/2" 11.6 # P-110 LT&C 7560 PSI 10,690 PSI 279,000#

The 12 ¼" Intermediate hole will be drilled to a total depth of 200' below the base of the Green River lost
circulation zone and 9 5/8" casing will be set to that depth. Actual setting depth of the 9 5/8" casing may be less
than 2700' in this well.

All casing will be new or inspected.

5. Float Eauipment:
Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Insert Baffle
Wooden wiper plug
Centralizers: 1 -- 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints(4 total).
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

STATE 1-32
SE/NW, SEC. 32, T10S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

Float Equipment (Continued):
Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'- 2700'):
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Cents.: 1-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5 jointto surface. (15 total)

Production Hole Procedure (2700'-TD'):
FS, 1 joint of casing, FC, and balance of casing to surface. Run 11.6#, N-80 burst rating or equivalent
marker collars or short casing joints at ± 7,687' (Top of Price River) and ± 4,500' (400' above the
Wasatch) (alter depth if needed to avoid placing across any potentially- productive intervals).
Centralize 5' above shoe on joint#1, top of joint#2, then every 2nd jointto 400' above Island top (50
total). Thread lock FS, top and bottom of FC, and top of 2nd

jOÎHt.

6. MUD PROGRAM

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'below GL):
Air - Air Water Mist

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'- 2700'):
Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

Production Hole Procedure (2700'-TD):
2700'- 4500' Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

4500'- 6900' Close in mud system. "Mud up" with 6.0 pob Diammonium Phosphate (DAP). Drill
with DAP water, POLYPLUS for viscosity and hole cleaning, adding KLA-GARD B for
supplemental inhibition. Also sweep hole periodically w/ Durogel / LCM sweeps to
clean the hole and seal loss zones. Add additional LCM as hole dictates. Mud weight
and vis as needed, water loss - no control.

6900'- TD Discontinue KLA-GARD B. Utilize POLYPAC-R for fluid loss control. Maintain f.g
pg DAP. Do not mix caustic or lime. Maintain 7.5-8.5 pH. Weight up system and
add vis as hole conditions require. Run LCM sweep periodically to seal off loss zones or
more oftenas hole dictates. Water loss: 20 cc's maximum. Expect increasing gas shows
requiring heavier mud weights from top of Island onward. Treat CO2 contamination with
DESCO CF and OSIL (Oxygen scavenger) if mud properties dictate.
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DESCO CF and OSIL (Oxygen scavenger) if mud properties dictate.
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STATE 1-32
SE/NW, SEC. 32, T10S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.
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Float Equipment (Continued):
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

STATE 1-32
SEINW, SEC. 32, T105, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:
A. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring a straight run blooie line (Where

possible, a straight run blooie line will be used).

B. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring an automatic ignitor or
continuous pilot light on the blooie line. (Not required on aerated water system).

C. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.
To reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be 75' in length.

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:
Logs: RST (Reservoir Saturation Tool) Cased logs TD to Surface

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:
Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'Below GL)
Lead: 300 sks (100%excess volume) Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2)& 0.25pps D29

(cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft3./sk.,4.95 gps water.

Top Out: Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% SI (CaCl2) in mix water, 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft3.lsk.,
4.95 gps via 1" tubing set at 25' if needed.

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'- 2700'):
Option 1:

Lead: 140 sks: (50% excess volume) Class 'G' lead cement (coverage from 1700-1000')
with 5% D44 (Salt), 12% D20 (Bentonite), 1% D79% (Extender), 0.25% D112
(Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D46 (Anti-Foamer) & 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes)
mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.91 ñ3/Sk., 24.5 gps water.

Tail: 475 sks: (50% excess volume) Class 'G' cement (coverage from 2700-1700') with
10% D53 (Gypsum), 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes) mixed at
14.2 ppg, 1.61 ft*/sk.,7.9 gps water.

Option 2:
Lead: 210 sks: (60% excess volume) Class 'G' lead cement (coverage from 2300-1800') with

2% BWOC (Calcium Chloride), ¼#lsk Flocele mixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 ft2/sk., 5.2 gps
water.

Tail: 720 sks: (60% excess volume) Class 'G' cement (coverage from 1800'-Surface) with 2%
BWOC (Calcium Chloride), ¼#lsk Flocelemixed at 15.6 ppg, 1.18 ft3/sk., 5.2 gps water.
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

STATE 1-32
SE/NW, SEC. 32, T108, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

CEMENT PROGRAM (Continued):
Production Hole Procedure (2700' to TD)
Lead: 440 sks 35:65 Poz G w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% DI74 (Extender), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),

0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% Dll2 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.15% D13 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29
(cello flakes), mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.73 cu. ft./sk.,9.06 gps water

Tail: 760 sks: 50:50 Poz G w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.15% D13 (Retarder),
0.2% D167 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 cu. ft./sk.,
5.9 gps water.

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:
Intermediate Hole (250'- 2700'):
Lost circulation below 1800' and minor amounts of gas may be present.

Production Hole (2700'-TD):
Sloughing shales and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch Formation. CO2
contamination in the mud is possible in the Price River (Mesa Verde).

I

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUSCHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.
Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG

EIGHT POINT PLAN

STATE 1-32
SE/NW, SEC. 32, T108, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

CEMENT PROGRAM (Continued):
Production Hole Procedure (2700' to TD)
Lead: 440 sks 35:65 Poz G w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% DI74 (Extender), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),

0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% Dll2 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.15% D13 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29
(cello flakes), mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.73 cu. ft./sk.,9.06 gps water

Tail: 760 sks: 50:50 Poz G w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.15% D13 (Retarder),
0.2% D167 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 cu. ft./sk.,
5.9 gps water.

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:
Intermediate Hole (250'- 2700'):
Lost circulation below 1800' and minor amounts of gas may be present.

Production Hole (2700'-TD):
Sloughing shales and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch Formation. CO2
contamination in the mud is possible in the Price River (Mesa Verde).

I

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUSCHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.
Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG

EIGHT POINT PLAN

STATE 1-32
SE/NW, SEC. 32, T108, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

CEMENT PROGRAM (Continued):
Production Hole Procedure (2700' to TD)
Lead: 440 sks 35:65 Poz G w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% DI74 (Extender), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),

0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% Dll2 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.15% D13 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29
(cello flakes), mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.73 cu. ft./sk.,9.06 gps water

Tail: 760 sks: 50:50 Poz G w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.15% D13 (Retarder),
0.2% D167 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 cu. ft./sk.,
5.9 gps water.

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:
Intermediate Hole (250'- 2700'):
Lost circulation below 1800' and minor amounts of gas may be present.

Production Hole (2700'-TD):
Sloughing shales and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch Formation. CO2
contamination in the mud is possible in the Price River (Mesa Verde).

I

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUSCHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.
Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG



5000 PSIG DIAGRAM

ANNULAR PREVENTOR AND BOTH RAMS ARE 5000 PSIG RATED.
CASING FLANGE IS 11" 5000 PSIG RATED. ROTATING HEAD
BOPE 11" 5000 PSIG

TESTING PROCEDURE: FLOW LINE
1. BOPE's will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2 ()

with retest every 14 days.
2. Blind & Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5000 psig. I I
3. Annular preventor will be tested to 50% of working pressure, 2500 psig.
4. Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi/ft or 2500 psig. Not to exceed 70% of burst MAR

strength, whichever is greater. PREVENTER
5. All lines subject to well pressure will be pressure-tested to the same pressure as

blind & pipe rams.
6. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2

requirements for 5000 psig BOPE specifications.

I PIPE RAMS
CHOKE MANIFOLD g |

2" MIN ADJUSTABLE CHOKE

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR
OR PIT BLIND RAMS

A 3" MINIMUM RATED O |
5000 PSIG

3" MINIMUM | 2" KILL LINE

BLEED LINE TO PIT 3" DIAMETER

CASING
2" MINIMUM ANG

SPOOL 11" 5000 PSIG

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR ADJUSTABLE CHOKE
OR

5000 PSIG DIAGRAM

ANNULAR PREVENTOR AND BOTH RAMS ARE 5000 PSIG RATED.
CASING FLANGE IS 11" 5000 PSIG RATED. ROTATING HEAD
BOPE 11" 5000 PSIG

TESTING PROCEDURE: FLOW LINE
1. BOPE's will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2 ()

with retest every 14 days.
2. Blind & Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5000 psig. I I
3. Annular preventor will be tested to 50% of working pressure, 2500 psig.
4. Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi/ft or 2500 psig. Not to exceed 70% of burst MAR

strength, whichever is greater. PREVENTER
5. All lines subject to well pressure will be pressure-tested to the same pressure as

blind & pipe rams.
6. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2

requirements for 5000 psig BOPE specifications.

I PIPE RAMS
CHOKE MANIFOLD g |

2" MIN ADJUSTABLE CHOKE

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR
OR PIT BLIND RAMS

A 3" MINIMUM RATED O |
5000 PSIG

3" MINIMUM | 2" KILL LINE

BLEED LINE TO PIT 3" DIAMETER

CASING
2" MINIMUM ANG

SPOOL 11" 5000 PSIG

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR ADJUSTABLE CHOKE
OR

5000 PSIG DIAGRAM

ANNULAR PREVENTOR AND BOTH RAMS ARE 5000 PSIG RATED.
CASING FLANGE IS 11" 5000 PSIG RATED. ROTATING HEAD
BOPE 11" 5000 PSIG

TESTING PROCEDURE: FLOW LINE
1. BOPE's will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2 ()

with retest every 14 days.
2. Blind & Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5000 psig. I I
3. Annular preventor will be tested to 50% of working pressure, 2500 psig.
4. Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi/ft or 2500 psig. Not to exceed 70% of burst MAR

strength, whichever is greater. PREVENTER
5. All lines subject to well pressure will be pressure-tested to the same pressure as

blind & pipe rams.
6. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2

requirements for 5000 psig BOPE specifications.

I PIPE RAMS
CHOKE MANIFOLD g |

2" MIN ADJUSTABLE CHOKE

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR
OR PIT BLIND RAMS

A 3" MINIMUM RATED O |
5000 PSIG

3" MINIMUM | 2" KILL LINE

BLEED LINE TO PIT 3" DIAMETER

CASING
2" MINIMUM ANG

SPOOL 11" 5000 PSIG

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR ADJUSTABLE CHOKE
OR



CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
FOR THE SURFACE USE PROGRAM OF THE

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
Well Name & Number: State 1-32
Lease Number: UT ST ML-48990' WpA
Location: 2152' FNL & 2067' FWL, SE/NW,

Sec. 32, T10S, Rl8E, S.L.B.&M.,
Uintah County, Utah

Surface Ownership: STATE OF UTAH

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction
of location and access roads.

Location Completion - prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Spud Notice: - at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to
spudding the well.

Casing String and
Cementing - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and cementing all casing strings.

BOP and related
Equipment Tests - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and tests.

First Production
Notice - within five (5) business days after new

Well begins or production resumes after
Well has been off production for more than
ninety (90) days.

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of
Approval for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.
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THIRTEEN POINT SURFACE USE PROGRAM

l. EXISTING ROADS

A. See attached Wellsite Plats showing directional reference stakes on location,
and attached TOPO Map "B" showing access to location from existing roads.

B. The proposed well site is located approximately 34.38 miles southeast of
Myton, Utah - See attached TOPO Map "A" .

C. Refer to attached Topographic Map "A" showing labeled access route to
location.

D. Existing roads will be maintained and repaired as necessary. No off lease
Right-of-Way will be required.

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROAD

A. An existing road will be rerouted to service this well. See attached TOPO
Map "B".

B. The access road has a 30 foot ROW w/ 18 foot running surface.
C. Maximum grade on access road will be 8%.
D. No turnouts will be required.
E. Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing

type.
F. No culverts, bridges, or major cuts and fills will be required.
G. The access road will be dirt surface.
H. No gates, cattleguards, or fences will be required or encountered.

New or reconstructed roads will be centerlined - flagged at time of location
staking.
All travel will be confined to existing access road Right-of-Way. Access roads
and surface disturbing activities will conform to standards outlined in the Bureau
of Land Management and Forest Service Publication: Surfàce Operating
Standards For Oil & Gas Exploration and Development, (1989).

The road shall be upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated traffic flow
and all-weather road requirements. Upgrading shall include ditching, drainage, graveling,
crowning, and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well-constructed safe road.
Prior to upgrading, the road shall be cleared of anysnow cover and allowed to dry
completely. Traveling off the 30 foot Right-of-Way will not be allowed.

Road drainage crossingsshall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing type.
Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause siltation or accumulation of debris in
the drainage crossings nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Diverting water
off at frequent intervals by means of cutouts shall prevent erosion of drainage ditches by
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run off water. Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions. Should mud
holes develop, they shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.
As operator, EOG Resources, Inc. shall be responsible for all maintenance on
cattleguards, or gates associated with this oil and/or gas operation.

3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A ONE MILE RADIUS OF
PROPOSED WELL LOCATION

A. Temporarily abandoned wells -
1*

(*See attached TOPO map "C" for location)

4. LOCATION OF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED FACILITIES

A. ON WELL PAD

1. Production facilities will be set on location if the well is successfully
completed for production. Facilities will consist of well head valves,
separator, dehy, 210 Bbl condensate tank, meter house and attaching
piping.

2. Gas gathering lines - A 4" gathering line will be buried from dehy to
the edge of the location.

B. OFF WELL PAD

1. Proposed location of attendant off pad flowlines shall be flagged prior
to archaeological clearance.

2. A 4" OD steelaboveground natural gas pipeline will be laid
approximately 12,600' from proposed location to a point in the
SW/SW of Section 15, T10S, R18E, where it will tie into Questar
Pipeline Co.'s existing line. Proposed pipeline crosses State of Utah
administered lands, thus a Right-of -Way grant will be required.

3. Proposed pipeline will be a 4" OD steel, welded line laid on the
surface.

4. Protective measures and devices for livestock and wildlife will be
taken and/or installed where required.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the well pad shall be surrounded by a containment dike
of sufficient capacity to contain, at a minimum, the entire contents of the
largest tank within the facility/battery, unless more stringent protective
requirements are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

The production facilities will be placed on the Southwest side of the
location.
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5. LOCATION & TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

A. Water supply will be from the Ouray Municipal Water Plant at Ouray, Utah,
and/or Target Trucking Inc.'s water source in the SWISW, Section 35, T9S,
R22E, Uintah County, Utah (State Water Right #49-1501). Produced water
from the Chapita Wells and Stagecoach Units will also be used.

B. Water will be hauled by a licensed trucking company.
C. No water well will be drilled on lease.

6. SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL
I

A. All construction material for this location and access road will be of native
borrow and soil accumulated during the construction of the location.

B. No mineral materials will be required.

7. METHODS OF HANDLINÇWASTE DISPOSAL

A. METHODS AND LOCATION
1. Cuttingswill be confined in thereserve pit.
2. A portable toilet will be provided for human waste during the drilling

and completion of the well. Disposal will be at the Vernal sewage
disposal plant.

3. Burning will not be allowed. Trash and other waste material will be
contained in a wire mesh cage and disposed of at the Uintah County
landfill.

4. Produced wastewater will be confined to a lined pit or storage tank for
a period not to exceed 90 days after initial production. After the 90
day period, the produced water will be contained in a tank on location
and then disposed of at one of the following three locations: Natural
Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD, Ace Disposal, or EOG Resources, Inc.
drilling operations (Chapita Wells Unit, Natural Buttes Unit &
Stagecoach Unit).

5. All chemicals will be disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Drip
pans and absorbent pads will be used on the drilling rig to avoid
leakage of oil to the pit.

B. Water from drilling fluids and recovered during testingoperationswill be
disposed of by either evaporating in the reservepit or be removed and
disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Introduction of well bore
hydrocarbons to the reserve pit will be avoided by flaring them off in the flare
pit at the time of recovery.

The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.
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8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES

A. No airstrips or campsareplanned for this well.

9. WELLSITE LAYOUT
A. Refer to attached well site plat for related topography cuts and fills and

cross sections.
B. Refer to attached well site plat for rig layout and soil material stockpile

location as approved on On-site.
C. Refer to attached well site plat for rig orientation, parking areas, and

access road.

The reserve pit will be located on the Northwest corner of the location.
The flare pit will be located downwind of the prevailing wind direction on
the North side of the location, a minimum of 100 feet from the well head
and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.
The stockpiled topsoil will be stored between Corners #5 and #6.

Access to the well pad will be from the North.

Corner #2 will be rounded off to minimize excavation.

FENCING REQUIREMENTS:

All pits will be fencedaccording to the following minimum standards:

A. Thirty-nine inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of barbed wire
on top of the net wire. (Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of
reinforcement rod is attached to the top of the entirefence).

B. The net wire shall be no more than2 inches above the ground. The barbed
wire strand shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence
shall be at least 42 inches.

C. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner as to keep the
fence tight at all times.

D. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

E. All wire shall be stretched by using a stretching device before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on the threesides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until clean-up.

State 1-32 D

O
8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES

A. No airstrips or campsareplanned for this well.

9. WELLSITE LAYOUT
A. Refer to attached well site plat for related topography cuts and fills and

cross sections.
B. Refer to attached well site plat for rig layout and soil material stockpile

location as approved on On-site.
C. Refer to attached well site plat for rig orientation, parking areas, and

access road.

The reserve pit will be located on the Northwest corner of the location.
The flare pit will be located downwind of the prevailing wind direction on
the North side of the location, a minimum of 100 feet from the well head
and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.
The stockpiled topsoil will be stored between Corners #5 and #6.

Access to the well pad will be from the North.

Corner #2 will be rounded off to minimize excavation.

FENCING REQUIREMENTS:

All pits will be fencedaccording to the following minimum standards:

A. Thirty-nine inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of barbed wire
on top of the net wire. (Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of
reinforcement rod is attached to the top of the entirefence).

B. The net wire shall be no more than2 inches above the ground. The barbed
wire strand shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence
shall be at least 42 inches.

C. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner as to keep the
fence tight at all times.

D. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

E. All wire shall be stretched by using a stretching device before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on the threesides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until clean-up.

State 1-32 D

O
8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES

A. No airstrips or campsareplanned for this well.

9. WELLSITE LAYOUT
A. Refer to attached well site plat for related topography cuts and fills and

cross sections.
B. Refer to attached well site plat for rig layout and soil material stockpile

location as approved on On-site.
C. Refer to attached well site plat for rig orientation, parking areas, and

access road.

The reserve pit will be located on the Northwest corner of the location.
The flare pit will be located downwind of the prevailing wind direction on
the North side of the location, a minimum of 100 feet from the well head
and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.
The stockpiled topsoil will be stored between Corners #5 and #6.

Access to the well pad will be from the North.

Corner #2 will be rounded off to minimize excavation.

FENCING REQUIREMENTS:

All pits will be fencedaccording to the following minimum standards:

A. Thirty-nine inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of barbed wire
on top of the net wire. (Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of
reinforcement rod is attached to the top of the entirefence).

B. The net wire shall be no more than2 inches above the ground. The barbed
wire strand shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence
shall be at least 42 inches.

C. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner as to keep the
fence tight at all times.

D. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

E. All wire shall be stretched by using a stretching device before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on the threesides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until clean-up.

State 1-32 D



9 O
10. PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE

A. PRODUCING LOCATION
Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash, and junknot
required for production.
Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be

removed in accordance with CFR 3162.7-1.
If a plastic nylon reinforcedliner is used, it shall be torn and perforated before

backfilling of the reserve pit.

11. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
Access road: State of Utah
Location: State of Utah

12. OTHER INFORMATION
A. EOG Resources, Inc. will inform all persons in the area who are associated

with this project that they are subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing
historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or
archaeological materialsare uncovered during construction, the operator will
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials, and contact
the AO. Within five working days the AO will inform the operator as to:

• whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of
Historic Places;

• the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake
before the site can be used.

• a time frame for the AO to complete an expedited review under 36
CFR 800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation
Officer, that the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation
is appropriate.

If the operator wished, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the
expense of mitigation and/or the delaysassociated with this process, the
AO will assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization
of the exposed materials thatmay be required. Otherwise, the operator
will be responsible for mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical
and procedural guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification
from the AO that required mitigation has been completed, the operator will
then be allowed to resume construction.
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LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION

PERMITTING AGENT DRILLING OPERATIONS
Ed Trotter Donald Presenkowski
P.O. Box 1910 EOG Resources, Inc.
Vernal, UT 84078 P.O. Box 250
Telephone: (435)789-4120 Big Piney, WY 83113
Fax: (435)789-1420 Telephone: (307)276-4865

All lease or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full
compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas
Orders, the approval plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.
EOG Resources, Inc. is fully responsible for the actions of their subcontractors. A
copy of theseconditions will be furnished to the field representative to insure
compliance.

Certification

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my directsupervision, have inspected the
proposed drillsite and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions that presently
exist; that the statements made in the Plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by EOG Resources, Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this Plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved.

Date Agent
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.
STATE #1-32

SECTION 32, T10S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION FROM MYTON, UTAH ALONG
U.S. HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 1.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATE
HIGHWAY 53; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 1.6 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATE HIGHWAY 216;
PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 9.8 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHWEST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHWESTERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY
6.8 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO
THE SOUTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY, THEN
NORTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 6.7 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN
RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY, THEN SOUTHWESTERLY
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.7 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD
AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHWEST; PROCEED IN A
SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 3.1 MILES TO THE
PROPOSED LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM MYTON, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL
LOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 31.2
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SCALE: 1" = 50' EOG RESOURCES, INC.
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STATE #1-32
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IIINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
Elev. Graded Ground at Location Stoke = 5571.4 as s.. 24, z... . v,,..z. ve., e447, . ¿ss;
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TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONSFOR
X-Section

scale STATE //1-32 0 s
SECTION 32, T10S, R18E, S.L.B.&M.

1" = 50' 2152' FNL 2067' FWL
DATE: 07-12-04
Drawn By D.COX

STA J+25
126' 135' Slope= 1 1/2:1

(Typ.)
LOCAT/0N STA

CUT

STA 1+50

75' 36' 135'

Preconstruction
Grade CUTF/LL VILL

cur STA 0+18

126' 135'

Finished Grade
cur

STA 0+00

NOTE: Earthwork Calculations Require a Fill of Within The Sub-Structure Area
For Balance. All Fill is to be Compacted to a Minimum of 95% of the
Maximum Dry Density Obtained by AASHTO Method t-99.

* NO1E
FILL QUANT/TY/NCLUDES
5% FOR COMPAC710N

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES EXCESS MATERIAL = J,2]O Cu. Yds.

CUT Topsoil & Pit Backfill - J,2]O Cu. Yds.
(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,570 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)

Remaining Location = 4,200 Cu. Yds. EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 5,770 CU.YDS.
(After Rehabilitation)

I FILL = 2,540 CU.YDS UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So, 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (436)
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4 WORKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PEKMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 07/16/2004 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-35839

WELL NAME: STATE 1-32

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC ( N9550 )

CONTACT: ED TROTTER PHONE NUMBER: 435-789-4120

PROPOSED LOCATION:

SENW 32 1005 180E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SURFACE: 2152 FNL 2067 FWL .Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 2152 FNL 2067 FWL

UINTAH Engineering /
WILDCAT ( 1 ) geology

LEASE TYPE: 3 - State Surface
LEASE NUMBER: ML-49054 L
SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State

LATITUDE: 39.90171
PROPOSED FORMATION: BLKHK

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: 109.91896

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3.

Bond:Fed[] Ind[] Sta[3] Fee[]
Unit

(No. JP-0921 Çý )
Potash (Y/N) e/ R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920'Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 49-1501 )
Drilling Unit

i RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:(Date: )
Eff Date:

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: g (i LA M
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Diana Whitney - Well clearance Page 1

From: Ed Bonner
To: Whitney, Diana
Date: 8/2/2004 4:33:26 PM
Subject: Well clearance

The following well has been given cultural resource clearance by the Trust Lands Cultural Resources
Group:

EOG Resources Inc
State 1-32

If you have any questions regarding thismatter please give me a call.

CC: Garrison, LaVonne; Hill,Brad; Hunt,
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O O
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
STATEMENT OF BASIS

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: STATE 1-32
API NUMBER: 43-047-35839
LOCATION:_1/4,1/4 SE/NW See: 32 TWP: 10S RNG:18E 2067' FWL 2152' NL

Geology/Ground Water:

EOG proposes to set 250 feet of surface casing cemented to the surface and 2,700 feet of intermediate casing
cemented with 615 sacks. The base of the moderately saline water is estimated at 5,000 feet. A search of
Division of Water Rights records shows no water wells within a 10,000 foot radius of the proposed location.
The surface formation at this location is the Uinta Formation. The Uinta Formation is made up of
discontinuous sands interbedded with shales and are not expected to produce prolific aquifers. The proposed
surface casing should adequately protect any near surface aquifers.

Reviewer: Brad Hill Date: 08-02-2004

Surface:

The predrill investigation of the surface was performed on 7/27/04. Surface and minerals for this well are owned
by the State of Utah. S.I.T.L.A. and D.W.R. were notified of this investigation on 7/19/04. Ed Bonner with
S.I.T.L.A. was present as was Floyd Bartlett with D.W.R Neither had any concerns regarding the construction of
this location or the drilling of this well. This site appears to be the best site for a location in the immediate area. An
existing two track reaches this site, and 400' of this road will be re-routed around the east side of the location. The
northeast corner of the reserve pit will have over seven feet of fill. For this reason Irecommend plastic pit linerhave
a felt subliner under it. Mr. Trotter agreed to this.

Reviewer: David W. Hackford Date: 7/30/04

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:

1. A synthetic liner with a minimum thickness of 12 mils and a felt subliner shall be properly installed and
maintained in the reserve

O O
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
STATEMENT OF BASIS

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: STATE 1-32
API NUMBER: 43-047-35839
LOCATION:_1/4,1/4 SE/NW See: 32 TWP: 10S RNG:18E 2067' FWL 2152' NL

Geology/Ground Water:

EOG proposes to set 250 feet of surface casing cemented to the surface and 2,700 feet of intermediate casing
cemented with 615 sacks. The base of the moderately saline water is estimated at 5,000 feet. A search of
Division of Water Rights records shows no water wells within a 10,000 foot radius of the proposed location.
The surface formation at this location is the Uinta Formation. The Uinta Formation is made up of
discontinuous sands interbedded with shales and are not expected to produce prolific aquifers. The proposed
surface casing should adequately protect any near surface aquifers.

Reviewer: Brad Hill Date: 08-02-2004

Surface:

The predrill investigation of the surface was performed on 7/27/04. Surface and minerals for this well are owned
by the State of Utah. S.I.T.L.A. and D.W.R. were notified of this investigation on 7/19/04. Ed Bonner with
S.I.T.L.A. was present as was Floyd Bartlett with D.W.R Neither had any concerns regarding the construction of
this location or the drilling of this well. This site appears to be the best site for a location in the immediate area. An
existing two track reaches this site, and 400' of this road will be re-routed around the east side of the location. The
northeast corner of the reserve pit will have over seven feet of fill. For this reason Irecommend plastic pit linerhave
a felt subliner under it. Mr. Trotter agreed to this.

Reviewer: David W. Hackford Date: 7/30/04

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:

1. A synthetic liner with a minimum thickness of 12 mils and a felt subliner shall be properly installed and
maintained in the reserve

O O
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
STATEMENT OF BASIS

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: STATE 1-32
API NUMBER: 43-047-35839
LOCATION:_1/4,1/4 SE/NW See: 32 TWP: 10S RNG:18E 2067' FWL 2152' NL

Geology/Ground Water:

EOG proposes to set 250 feet of surface casing cemented to the surface and 2,700 feet of intermediate casing
cemented with 615 sacks. The base of the moderately saline water is estimated at 5,000 feet. A search of
Division of Water Rights records shows no water wells within a 10,000 foot radius of the proposed location.
The surface formation at this location is the Uinta Formation. The Uinta Formation is made up of
discontinuous sands interbedded with shales and are not expected to produce prolific aquifers. The proposed
surface casing should adequately protect any near surface aquifers.

Reviewer: Brad Hill Date: 08-02-2004

Surface:

The predrill investigation of the surface was performed on 7/27/04. Surface and minerals for this well are owned
by the State of Utah. S.I.T.L.A. and D.W.R. were notified of this investigation on 7/19/04. Ed Bonner with
S.I.T.L.A. was present as was Floyd Bartlett with D.W.R Neither had any concerns regarding the construction of
this location or the drilling of this well. This site appears to be the best site for a location in the immediate area. An
existing two track reaches this site, and 400' of this road will be re-routed around the east side of the location. The
northeast corner of the reserve pit will have over seven feet of fill. For this reason Irecommend plastic pit linerhave
a felt subliner under it. Mr. Trotter agreed to this.

Reviewer: David W. Hackford Date: 7/30/04

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:

1. A synthetic liner with a minimum thickness of 12 mils and a felt subliner shall be properly installed and
maintained in the reserve



O O
ON- SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: STATE 1-32
API NUMBER:43-047-35839

LEASE: ML-48380 FIELD/UNIT: WILDCAT
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 SE/NW Sec: 32 TWP:10S RNG: 18E 2067' FWL 2152' FNL
LEGAL WELL SITING: 460 F SEC. LINE; 460 F 1/4,1/4 LINE; 920 F ANOTHER WELL.
GPS COORD (UTM): 592382E 4417422N SURFACE OWNER: STATE OF UTAH.

PARTICIPANTS

DAVID W. RACKFORD (DOGM), ED TROTTER (EOG), FLOYD BARTLETT (DWR), ED
BONNER (SITLA).

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY

SITE IS IN AN AREA OF LOW ROLLING HILLS AND SHALLOW DRAWS DRAINING
GRADUALLY TO THE EAST TO THE GREEN RIVER. THE GREEN RIVER IS TWO MILES
TO THE EAST, WHILE THE RIM OF THE UPPER END OF DESOLATION CANYON IS ONE
MILE TO THE EAST. SAND WASH IS FOUR MILES TO THE SOUTH, AND SHEEP WASH
IS FOUR MILES TO THE NORTH. BOTH OF THESE DRAIN TO THE EAST TO THE
GREEN RIVER. MYTON, UTAH IS 34.4 MILES TO THE NORTHWEST.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE: WILDLIFE AND LIVESTOCK GRAZING, HUNTING.

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: LOCATION WILL BE 325' BY 246'. PROPOSED
ACCESS IS 3.1 MILES OF EXISTING TWO TRACK WHICH WILL BE UPGRADED.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: SEE ATTACHED MAP FROM
GIS DATABASE.

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: NEW PRODUCTION
FACILITIES WILL BE ON LOCATION AND ADDED AFTER DRILLING WELL. PIPELINE
WILL FOLLOW ACCESS ROAD.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: ALL CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL WILL BE
BORROWED FROM SITE DURING CONSTRUCTION.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: NONE WILL BE REQUIRED.

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

DRILLED CUTTINGS WILL BE SETTLED INTO RESERVE PIT. LIQUIDS FROM PIT WILL
BE ALLOWED TO EVAPORATE. FORMATION WATER WILL BE CONFINED TO STORAGE
TANKS. SEWAGE FACILITIES, STORAGE AND DISPOSAL WILL BE HANDLED BY
COMMERCIAL CONTRACTOR. TRASH WILL BE CONTAINED IN TRASH BASKETS AND
HAULED TO AN APPROVED LAND
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ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETE

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: NONE

FLORA/FAUNA: HALOGETON, SHADSCALE, PRICKLEY PEAR, SALTBRUSH, CHEAT
GRASS: PRONGHORN, COYOTES, SONGBIRDS, RAPTORS, RODENTS, RABBITS.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: LIGHT BROWN SANDY CLAY.

EROSION/SEDIMENTATION/STABILITY: VERY LITTLE NATURAL EROSION.
SEDIMENTATION AND STABILITY ARE NOT A PROBLEM AND LOCATION CONSTRUCTION
SHOULDN'T CAUSE AN INCREASE IN STABILITY OR EROSION PROBLEMS.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: NONE OBSERVED.
RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: 147' BY 75' AND 12' DEEP.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): A 12 MIL LINER WITH A
FELT SUBLINER WILL BE REQUIRED FOR THE RESERVE PIT.

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN: AS PER S.I.T.L.A.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: AS PER STATE OF UTAH

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: SITE HAS BEEN INSPECTED BY JIM TRUESDALE.

OTHER OBSERVATIONS/COMMENTS

THIS PREDRILL INVESTIGATION WAS CONDUCTED ON A HOT, SUNNY DAY.

ATTACHMENTS

PHOTOS OF THIS SITE WERE TAKEN AND PLACED ON FILE.

DAVID W. HACKFORD 7/27/04 11:30 AM
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE
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uation Ranking Criteria and Ranking re
For Reserve and Onsite Pit Liner Requirements

site-specific Factors Ranking Site Ranking

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
>200 0
100 to 200 5
75 to 100 10
25 to 75 15
<25 or recharge area 20 _5

Distance to Surf. Water (feet)
>1000 0
300 to 1000 2
200 to 300 10
100 to 200 15
< 100 20 0

Distance to Nearest Municipal
Well (feet)

>5280 0
1320 to 5280 5
500 to 1320 10
<500 20 0

Distance to Other Wells (feet)
>1320 0
300 to 1320 10
<300 20 _0

Native Soil Type
Low permeability o
Mod. permeability 10
High permeability 20 _10

Fluid Type
Air/mist 0
Fresh Water 5
PDS >5000 and <10000 10
TDS >10000 or Oil Base Mud Fluid 15

containing significant levels of
hazardous constituents 20 5

Drill Cuttings
Normal Rock 0
Salt or detrimental 10 __0

Annual Precipitation (inches)
<10 0
10 to 20 5
>20 10

__

0

Affected Populations
<10 0
10 to 30 6
30 to 50 8
>50 10 0

Presence of Nearby Utility
Conduits

Not Present 0
Unknown 10
Present 15 0

Final Score 20 (Level I Sensitivity)

SensitivityLevel I = 20 or more; total containment is reggire(L
Sensitivity Izvel II - 15-19; lining is discretionary.
Sensitivity Level III = below 15;no specific lining is required
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From: Ed Trotter <edtrotter@easilink.com>

To: Clinton Dworshak <clintondworshak@utah.gov>

Date: 8/3/2004 10:55:03 AM
Subject: Revised DrillingProgram

Clint,
Attached is a revised DrillingProgram for the State 1-32 wellwhich replaces the version mailed withthe
APD.
Thanks,
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Subject: Revised DrillingProgram
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Attached is a revised DrillingProgram for the State 1-32 wellwhich replaces the version mailed withthe
APD.
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From: Ed Trotter <edtrotter@easilink.com>

To: Clinton Dworshak <clintondworshak@utah.gov>

Date: 8/3/2004 10:55:03 AM
Subject: Revised DrillingProgram

Clint,
Attached is a revised DrillingProgram for the State 1-32 wellwhich replaces the version mailed withthe
APD.
Thanks,



O O
wellname: 07-04 EOG State 1-32
Operator: EOG
stringtype: Surface Project ID:

43-047-35839
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collaose: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 68 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 220 ft

Buntt
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
x anticipated surface
pressure: 50 psi

Intemal gradient: 0.442 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 160 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 3,200 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.800 ppg
Neutral point: 219 ft Next setting BHP: 1,463 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 250 ft
injection pressure 250 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (In) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 250 13.375 48.00 H-40 ST&C 250 250 12.59 23.5

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 109 740 6.783 160 1730 10.79 12 322 26.83 J

Prepared ClintonDworshak Date: August 4,2004
by: Utah Div.of Oil&Mining Salt Lake City,Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 250 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe that of the

O O
wellname: 07-04 EOG State 1-32
Operator: EOG
stringtype: Surface Project ID:

43-047-35839
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collaose: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 68 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 220 ft

Buntt
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
x anticipated surface
pressure: 50 psi

Intemal gradient: 0.442 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 160 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 3,200 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.800 ppg
Neutral point: 219 ft Next setting BHP: 1,463 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 250 ft
injection pressure 250 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (In) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 250 13.375 48.00 H-40 ST&C 250 250 12.59 23.5

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 109 740 6.783 160 1730 10.79 12 322 26.83 J

Prepared ClintonDworshak Date: August 4,2004
by: Utah Div.of Oil&Mining Salt Lake City,Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 250 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe that of the

O O
wellname: 07-04 EOG State 1-32
Operator: EOG
stringtype: Surface Project ID:

43-047-35839
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collaose: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 68 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 220 ft

Buntt
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
x anticipated surface
pressure: 50 psi

Intemal gradient: 0.442 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 160 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 3,200 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.800 ppg
Neutral point: 219 ft Next setting BHP: 1,463 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 250 ft
injection pressure 250 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (In) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 250 13.375 48.00 H-40 ST&C 250 250 12.59 23.5

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 109 740 6.783 160 1730 10.79 12 322 26.83 J

Prepared ClintonDworshak Date: August 4,2004
by: Utah Div.of Oil&Mining Salt Lake City,Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 250 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemier method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe that of the



O O
Well name: 07-04 EOG State 1-32
Operator: EOG
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-047-35839
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.800 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 *F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 110 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 300 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: 534 ft

Burst
Maxanticipated surface

pressure: 2,816 psi
Intemal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,200 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Bodyyield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 11,700 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 10.500 ppg
Neutral point: 2,783 ft Next setting BHP: 6,382 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 3,200 ft
Injection pressure 3,200 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 3200 9.625 36.00 J-55 ST&C 3200 3200 8.796 227.9

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 1463 2020 1.381 3200 3520 1.10 115 394 3.42 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: August 4,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil& Mining Salt Lake City,Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 3200 ft, a mud weight of 8.8 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thIs design wi/Ibe that of the

O O
Well name: 07-04 EOG State 1-32
Operator: EOG
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-047-35839
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.800 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 *F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 110 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 300 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: 534 ft

Burst
Maxanticipated surface

pressure: 2,816 psi
Intemal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,200 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Bodyyield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 11,700 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 10.500 ppg
Neutral point: 2,783 ft Next setting BHP: 6,382 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 3,200 ft
Injection pressure 3,200 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 3200 9.625 36.00 J-55 ST&C 3200 3200 8.796 227.9

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 1463 2020 1.381 3200 3520 1.10 115 394 3.42 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: August 4,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil& Mining Salt Lake City,Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 3200 ft, a mud weight of 8.8 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thIs design wi/Ibe that of the

O O
Well name: 07-04 EOG State 1-32
Operator: EOG
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-047-35839
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collaose Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.800 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 *F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 110 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 300 ft

Burst:
n factor 1.00 Cement top: 534 ft

Burst
Maxanticipated surface

pressure: 2,816 psi
Intemal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 3,200 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Bodyyield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 11,700 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 10.500 ppg
Neutral point: 2,783 ft Next setting BHP: 6,382 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 3,200 ft
Injection pressure 3,200 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 3200 9.625 36.00 J-55 ST&C 3200 3200 8.796 227.9

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 1463 2020 1.381 3200 3520 1.10 115 394 3.42 J

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: August 4,2004
by: Utah Div. of Oil& Mining Salt Lake City,Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 3200 ft, a mud weight of 8.8 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of thIs design wi/Ibe that of the



O O
Well name: 07-04 EOG State 1-32
Operator: EOG
String type: Production Project ID:

43-047-35839
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collanse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mudweight: 10.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 229 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 220 ft

Bumli
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 6,642 ft

Burst
x anticipated surface
pressure: 50 psi

Intemal gradient: 0.541 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 6,382 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Bodyyield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 9,863 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured
DÑÃ¯

Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (fta)
1 11700 4.5 11.60 P-110 LT&C 11700 11700 3.875 271.2

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
i 6382 7580 1.188 6382 10690 1.68 136 279 2.06 J

Prepared ClintonDworshak Date: August 4,2004
by: Utah Div.of Oil&Mining Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 11700 ft, a mud weight of 10.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe thatof the

O O
Well name: 07-04 EOG State 1-32
Operator: EOG
String type: Production Project ID:

43-047-35839
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collanse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mudweight: 10.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 229 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 220 ft

Bumli
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 6,642 ft

Burst
x anticipated surface
pressure: 50 psi

Intemal gradient: 0.541 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 6,382 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Bodyyield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 9,863 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured
DÑÃ¯

Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (fta)
1 11700 4.5 11.60 P-110 LT&C 11700 11700 3.875 271.2

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
i 6382 7580 1.188 6382 10690 1.68 136 279 2.06 J

Prepared ClintonDworshak Date: August 4,2004
by: Utah Div.of Oil&Mining Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 11700 ft, a mud weight of 10.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe thatof the

O O
Well name: 07-04 EOG State 1-32
Operator: EOG
String type: Production Project ID:

43-047-35839
Location: Uintah County

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collanse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mudweight: 10.500 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F
Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 229 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 220 ft

Bumli
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 6,642 ft

Burst
x anticipated surface
pressure: 50 psi

Intemal gradient: 0.541 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 6,382 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Bodyyield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 9,863 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured
DÑÃ¯

Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (fta)
1 11700 4.5 11.60 P-110 LT&C 11700 11700 3.875 271.2

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
i 6382 7580 1.188 6382 10690 1.68 136 279 2.06 J

Prepared ClintonDworshak Date: August 4,2004
by: Utah Div.of Oil&Mining Salt Lake City, Utah

Remarks:
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 11700 ft, a mud weight of 10.5 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.

Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design wi/Ibe thatof the



OLENE S. WALKER
Governor

GAYLE F. McKEACHNIE
,,,, Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah

Department of
Natural Resources

ROBERT L. MORGAN
Exeanire Director August 6, 2004

Division of
Oil, Gas & Mining EOG Resources, Inc.
LOWELL P. BRAXTON PO Box 1815

Division Direa°r Vernal, UT 84078

Re: State 1-32 Well, 2152' FNL, 2067' FWL, SE NW, Sec. 32, T. 10 South,
R. 18 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

- Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et

seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of

Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and

continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-35839.

c) John R. Baza
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
SITLA

/
1594 West North Temple, Suite 12 l0, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114 5801
telephone (801) 538-5340•facsimile (801) 359-3940•TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gor Where ideas
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O O
Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.

Well Name & Number State 1-32

API Number: 43-047-35839
Lease: ML-49054

Location: SE NW Sec. 32 T. 10 South R. 18 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:

• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
• 24 hours prior to spudding the well
• within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
• prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

• Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

5. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)

6. A 4 ½ " production casing cement shall be brought back to 4000' minirnum to protect
Wasatch

O O
Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.

Well Name & Number State 1-32

API Number: 43-047-35839
Lease: ML-49054

Location: SE NW Sec. 32 T. 10 South R. 18 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:

• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
• 24 hours prior to spudding the well
• within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
• prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

• Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

5. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)

6. A 4 ½ " production casing cement shall be brought back to 4000' minirnum to protect
Wasatch

O O
Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.

Well Name & Number State 1-32

API Number: 43-047-35839
Lease: ML-49054

Location: SE NW Sec. 32 T. 10 South R. 18 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
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numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):
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• Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archeological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

5. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy Attached)

6. A 4 ½ " production casing cement shall be brought back to 4000' minirnum to protect
Wasatch
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7. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns)
have not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the
"Board"). In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the
operator is requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to
analyze geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data
from surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its
analysis, and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon
which the well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate
order from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such
analysis by filing a Request for Agency Action with the
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: EOG RESOURCES INC

Well Name: STATE 1-32

Api No: 43-047-35839 Lease Type: STATE

Section 32 Township IOS Range 18E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor CRAIGS ROUSTABOUT SER RIG # AIR

SPUDDED:
Date 08/7/04

Time 3:00 PM

How DRY

Drilling will commence:

Reported by ED TROTTER

Telephone# 1-435-789-4120

Date 08/11/2004 Signed
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OMSION OF OIL, GAS ANDMINING OPERATOR: EOGResources, Inc. FAX: EARLENE RUSSELL
ADDRESS: P.O. BOK250 (801) 399-3940

ENTITYACTIONFORM - FORM6 BIGPINEY,WYOMING83113

ACTION CLIRRENT NEW APl WELL NAME LOCATiCN SPUD EFFEGHVE
CODE ENTiff NO ENTITYMO. NUMBER 00 SEC. TP RO COUMTY DATE DATE

A 99999 (
43-047-35839 STATE 1-32 SENW 32 i GS 18E UINTAH 8/712004

99999 43-047-34637 CHAPITAWELLSUNIT641-1 SWSW 1 BS 22E UINTAH 8/11/2004

C3

ACrioNS CODES (See betections en back of form)
A - Establishnew entRyfor new wel (single weianly) -7

8 - Add new weitto exisUng entity (groupor util wel] Sign
c - R.-assign waritramone existing enar toanother emisungemity Sr. Assistant 8/12/2004
D - Re-assign well frain one existing enity to a new entKy TÍUB
E -Other(explain in connants section)

NOTE: Use COMMENTsecdom to explah wiryeach AchonCode was selected. Phone No. (307) 276-4833

RECEIVED
AUGI 2 2004

OFO GAS&
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

ggg DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UT ST ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1.TYPEOFYVELL 8.\NELLNAMEandNUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STATE 1-32
2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4304735839
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR; PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
P.O. BOX 250 BIG PINEY WY 83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL - 2067' FWL couNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completlon:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: WELL SPUD
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly Show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. spud a 12-1/2" surface hole at the referenced location 8/07/2004 at 3:00 p.m. The contractor was Craig's
Roustabout Service. Ed Trotter, representative for EOG, notified Ed Forsrnan of the Vernal BLM office and Carol Daniels of
the Utah Division of OilGas and Mining of the spud 8/07/2004.

D a

NAME(PLEASE PRIN Alfr a Schul T TL Sr R2eg00\atoryAssistant

(This space for State use only)

RECElVED
AUS16 2004

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIVOFOlL,GAS&
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
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6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
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(This space for State use only)
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AUS16 2004

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
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(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completlon:
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(This space for State use only)
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(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIVOFOlL,GAS&
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

ggg DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UT ST ML-48380
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7, UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterals, Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STATE 1-32

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4304735839
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
P.O. BOX250 a.,.- BIG PINEY WY ,83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE; 2152' FNL - 2067' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E S STATE;
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^clolze O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON
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(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLËTE - OfFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly showall pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization for disposal of produced water from the referenced well to any of the following
locations.

1. Natural Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD.
2. Ace Disposal.
3. EOG Resources, Inc. drillingoperations (Chapita Wells Unit, Natural Buttes Unit, Stagecoach Unit).
4. RN Industries.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

FO RC D NLY

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Alfreda Schulz

SIGNATURE \

ATLE r e latory Assistant

(This space for Stato use only)

RECEIVED
AU616 2004

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DNOFOiL,GAS&
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STATEOFUTAH FORM9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

UT ST ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
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2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9, API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4304735839
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX 250 ,., BIG PINEY WY 83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE; 2152' FNL - 2067' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT" (Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart; CASING REPA1R NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER D1SPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMAT10NOF WELLSITE OTHER: DRILLING
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPERATIONS

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show a1I pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, eto

Please see the attached well chronology report for drilling operations frorn 8/07/2004 - 9/09/2004. -

SNAME(PLEASEP Al da Schulz DATE Sr Reg0ulatoryAssistant

(Tids space for State use only) RECElVED
SEP13 2004

(92000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side> DIV.OFOILGAS&MININ

O O
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O O

WELL CHRONOLOGY
ac¾ resources REPORT

so Report Generated On: 09-09-2004

Well Name STATE01-32 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER
Field BIG SPRING API # 43-047-35839 Well Class COMP
County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date
Tax Credit N TVD I MD 11,700/l1,700 Property # 055517
Water Depth 0 Last CSG 4.5 Shoe TVD / MD 11,695/11,695
KB / GL Elev 5,585/5,571

Location Section32, T10S,RISE, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE
Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total 2,108,600 DHC / CWC 1,340,000/ 768,600
Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-23-2004 Release Date 08-30-2004
07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: DrilHug Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONDATA

2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW)

SECTION32, T10S, R18E
UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH

TD: I1,700'BLACKHAWK
TRUE RIG #9

WC/GAS
BIG SPRING PROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML-48380

ELEVATION:5572' NAT GL, 5571' PREP GL, 5585' KB (14')

EOG WI 50%, NRI 43.75%

DOMINIONEXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%
08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIE TROTTER
DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0Formation : PBTD : 0.0

. Perf : PKR Depth :

O O

WELL CHRONOLOGY
ac¾ resources REPORT
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, WellName: STATE 01-32
Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06.00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG'SAIR RIG. SPUDDED 17½ "HOLE @ 3:00 PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED 17 1/2" HOLETO230'. RAN5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#/FT, H--40, ST&CCASING & LANDED @238.90'KB. RUBIG 4 CEMENTING.PRESSURE TESTEDLINESANDCEMENTVALVETO 1000PSIG. MIXED&PUMPED20 BBLSGELLED WATER& 20 BBLSWATER FLUSH AHEADOF CEMENT. MIXED & PUMPED225SX CLASS "G" CEMENTW/2% CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE, MIXEDCEMENT@15.8 PPGW/YIELD OF 1.15CFISX(47.2BBLS), DISPLACEDCEMENT W/29BBLS WATER& SHUT-IN CASING VALVE.HAD 12 BBLSCEMENTRETURNS TO SURFACE.RD BIG 4. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROPFROMREPORT UNTIL FURTHERACTIVITY.

ED TROTTER NOTIFIED CAROLDANIELSW/UOGM OF SPUDDINGWELL AT 1:00PM, 8/7/04.08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR
DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily TotalCum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 1,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days l MW 8.4 Visc 26.0Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRUTRUE RIG #9.
10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER, HCRAND HOOK UP CHOKE LINES.
13:30 14:30 1.0 PICK UP 12 1/4"EHP51BIT,5/6 LOBE 4 STAGE MOTOR, SHOCKSUB AND DC'S TOTOP OF CEMENT AT 214'.14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILL CEMENT& FLOAT EQUIP 214' TO 239'.
15:30 16:30 1.0 DRILL RGIATE 229' TO 285' (56') 56'lHR. 18/20K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.
16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.
17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 285' TO 350' (65') 65'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.
18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.
18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILLROTATE350' TO 588' (238') 47.6'/HR. 22/25K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.
23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY@503', 3/4 DEG.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILLROTATE 588' TO 1005' (417') 69.5'/HR. 38/40KWOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIG ON DAY WORK 10:00 AM, 8/12/04
NOTIFIED UTAH DNR (CARROL DANIELS) OF INTENT TO SPUD @08:30 8/12/04

FUEL AT STARTOF JOB 2200 GAL
SAFETYMEETING: PICKINGUP COLLARS, RUNNING SLICK LINE SURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7-7/8" HOLE AT 3:30 PM, 8/12/04
08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal '
MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0Activity at Report Time: DRILLTNG

Page
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, Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 l.5 DRILL& ROTATE1005' TO 1117'(112') 74.6'/HR,38/40KWOB,155R.PM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY@1048', 3/4 DEG.
08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1117'TO 1365'(248') 99.2'/HR, 38/45K WOB, 127 RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.
11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE 1365'TO 1610' (245') 61 2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.
15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540', 2 1/2 DEG.
15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1610' TO 1927 (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130RPM.
22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY@1843', 2 3/4 DEG.
22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1927' TO 2260'(333') 44.4'/HR, 45/48KWOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:REPAIRPUMP/WORKINGWITHNEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY
TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS
BGG-72, CG-378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: SHORT TRIP PRIORTO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE2260' TO2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.
08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY@2300', 1 1/4DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE 2370' TO2457' (8T) 43.5'/HR, 48/52K WOB,45/82 RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER,
11:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE2457' TO 2865' (408') 45.3'/HR, 48/52K WOB,45/82 RPM.
20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY @2780', 2 DEG.
20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE2865' TO3200' (335') 44.6'lHR, 48/52K WOB,45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSINGWATER AT±3000'LOST TOTAL OF 640 BBLSEST.
04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3113', 1 DEG.
04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITHLCM SWEEP,
05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORTTRIP TODRILLCOLLARS. HOLETAKING2 TIMES NORMAL FILL

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNINGFORK LIFT, WIRE LINE SURVEYS
TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION: GREENRIVER20% SH, 35% SS, 45% LS
BGG 34, CG 43

08--16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling

. Completion WellTotal
MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Vise 26.0
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10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.
11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE 1365'TO 1610' (245') 61 2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.
15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540', 2 1/2 DEG.
15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1610' TO 1927 (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130RPM.
22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY@1843', 2 3/4 DEG.
22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1927' TO 2260'(333') 44.4'/HR, 45/48KWOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:REPAIRPUMP/WORKINGWITHNEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY
TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS
BGG-72, CG-378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: SHORT TRIP PRIORTO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE2260' TO2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.
08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY@2300', 1 1/4DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE 2370' TO2457' (8T) 43.5'/HR, 48/52K WOB,45/82 RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER,
11:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE2457' TO 2865' (408') 45.3'/HR, 48/52K WOB,45/82 RPM.
20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY @2780', 2 DEG.
20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE2865' TO3200' (335') 44.6'lHR, 48/52K WOB,45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSINGWATER AT±3000'LOST TOTAL OF 640 BBLSEST.
04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3113', 1 DEG.
04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITHLCM SWEEP,
05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORTTRIP TODRILLCOLLARS. HOLETAKING2 TIMES NORMAL FILL

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNINGFORK LIFT, WIRE LINE SURVEYS
TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION: GREENRIVER20% SH, 35% SS, 45% LS
BGG 34, CG 43

08--16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling

. Completion WellTotal
MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Vise 26.0
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, Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 l.5 DRILL& ROTATE1005' TO 1117'(112') 74.6'/HR,38/40KWOB,155R.PM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY@1048', 3/4 DEG.
08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1117'TO 1365'(248') 99.2'/HR, 38/45K WOB, 127 RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.
11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE 1365'TO 1610' (245') 61 2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.
15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540', 2 1/2 DEG.
15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1610' TO 1927 (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130RPM.
22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY@1843', 2 3/4 DEG.
22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1927' TO 2260'(333') 44.4'/HR, 45/48KWOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:REPAIRPUMP/WORKINGWITHNEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY
TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS
BGG-72, CG-378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: SHORT TRIP PRIORTO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE2260' TO2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.
08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY@2300', 1 1/4DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE 2370' TO2457' (8T) 43.5'/HR, 48/52K WOB,45/82 RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER,
11:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE2457' TO 2865' (408') 45.3'/HR, 48/52K WOB,45/82 RPM.
20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY @2780', 2 DEG.
20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE2865' TO3200' (335') 44.6'lHR, 48/52K WOB,45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSINGWATER AT±3000'LOST TOTAL OF 640 BBLSEST.
04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3113', 1 DEG.
04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITHLCM SWEEP,
05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORTTRIP TODRILLCOLLARS. HOLETAKING2 TIMES NORMAL FILL

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNINGFORK LIFT, WIRE LINE SURVEYS
TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION: GREENRIVER20% SH, 35% SS, 45% LS
BGG 34, CG 43

08--16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling

. Completion WellTotal
MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Vise 26.0
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. WellName: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE, NO FILL, NO DRAG.
07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL& ROTATE 3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 ClRCULATEDBOTTOMS UP,CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILLADDITIONAL89' DUE TO DRILL BREAKS.
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'/HR, 48/50KWOB, 45/82 RPM.
11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE.CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.
12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED DIVERTER.
13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL& ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.
14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATE BOTTOMSUP. SPOT 75 BBLS LCMPILLON BOTTOM.
15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUTOF HOLETO RUN CASING.
16:30 (7:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE. LAID DOWN3 - 8" COLLARS,MOTOR AND SHOCKSUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELDPRE--JOBSAFETY MEETING. RIG UPAND RUN9 5/8" CASINGAS FOLLOWS:GUIDESHOE, 1 FLOATJOINT, FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RAN TOTAL OF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASINGSHOELANDED AT 3400', FLOAT COLLAR AT 3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS S' ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,THENEVERY 5TH JT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOM OF FLOATCOLLAR.
23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUGRETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITHRIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCHTO SCHLUMBERGER, LEAD Wl285SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12%D20, 1% D79, .25% D112, .2% D46, .25PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0PPG,YIELD 3.91.TAIL WITH320 SXS "G" W/10%D53, 2% Sl, .25 PPS D29,MIXED AT14.2 PPGYIELD 1.61. DROPPED PLUGANDDISPLACED WITH 260 BBLSWATER,DID NOT BUMP PLUG, HADFULLRETURNSTHROUGH OUT JOB WITH50 BBLSCEMENT TO SURFACE.RELEASEPSI, FLOAT EQUIP,HELD. RDMOSCHLUMBERGER.
03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER,SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSG WITH 98K STRINGWT.
04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUEND DIVERTER AND REMOVEFROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING:OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING
NOTIFIED UTAHDOG&MOF INTENTTO SETAND CEMENT INTERMEDIATECASING(LEFTCAROLDANIELSA MESSAGE) AT 09:30AM, 8/15/04
RECIEVED 73 JTS 9 5/8"CASINGFROMBUNNING& S JTS FROM VERNALYARD,TOTALPIPE ON LOCATION3451'

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 35%SH, 25%SS, 10%SLTST, 30%LS
08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINAL CUTON 9 5/8". INSTALLED"B" SECTIONAND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.
07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RSTLOG WITH SCHLUMBERGERWHILENU BOP'S.
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Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER
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23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUGRETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITHRIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCHTO SCHLUMBERGER, LEAD Wl285SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12%D20, 1% D79, .25% D112, .2% D46, .25PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0PPG,YIELD 3.91.TAIL WITH320 SXS "G" W/10%D53, 2% Sl, .25 PPS D29,MIXED AT14.2 PPGYIELD 1.61. DROPPED PLUGANDDISPLACED WITH 260 BBLSWATER,DID NOT BUMP PLUG, HADFULLRETURNSTHROUGH OUT JOB WITH50 BBLSCEMENT TO SURFACE.RELEASEPSI, FLOAT EQUIP,HELD. RDMOSCHLUMBERGER.
03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER,SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSG WITH 98K STRINGWT.
04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUEND DIVERTER AND REMOVEFROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING:OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING
NOTIFIED UTAHDOG&MOF INTENTTO SETAND CEMENT INTERMEDIATECASING(LEFTCAROLDANIELSA MESSAGE) AT 09:30AM, 8/15/04
RECIEVED 73 JTS 9 5/8"CASINGFROMBUNNING& S JTS FROM VERNALYARD,TOTALPIPE ON LOCATION3451'

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 35%SH, 25%SS, 10%SLTST, 30%LS
08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINAL CUTON 9 5/8". INSTALLED"B" SECTIONAND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.
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. WellName: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE, NO FILL, NO DRAG.
07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL& ROTATE 3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 ClRCULATEDBOTTOMS UP,CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILLADDITIONAL89' DUE TO DRILL BREAKS.
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'/HR, 48/50KWOB, 45/82 RPM.
11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE.CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.
12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.
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14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATE BOTTOMSUP. SPOT 75 BBLS LCMPILLON BOTTOM.
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16:30 (7:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE. LAID DOWN3 - 8" COLLARS,MOTOR AND SHOCKSUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELDPRE--JOBSAFETY MEETING. RIG UPAND RUN9 5/8" CASINGAS FOLLOWS:GUIDESHOE, 1 FLOATJOINT, FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RAN TOTAL OF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASINGSHOELANDED AT 3400', FLOAT COLLAR AT 3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS S' ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,THENEVERY 5TH JT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOM OF FLOATCOLLAR.
23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUGRETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITHRIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCHTO SCHLUMBERGER, LEAD Wl285SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12%D20, 1% D79, .25% D112, .2% D46, .25PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0PPG,YIELD 3.91.TAIL WITH320 SXS "G" W/10%D53, 2% Sl, .25 PPS D29,MIXED AT14.2 PPGYIELD 1.61. DROPPED PLUGANDDISPLACED WITH 260 BBLSWATER,DID NOT BUMP PLUG, HADFULLRETURNSTHROUGH OUT JOB WITH50 BBLSCEMENT TO SURFACE.RELEASEPSI, FLOAT EQUIP,HELD. RDMOSCHLUMBERGER.
03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER,SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSG WITH 98K STRINGWT.
04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUEND DIVERTER AND REMOVEFROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING:OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING
NOTIFIED UTAHDOG&MOF INTENTTO SETAND CEMENT INTERMEDIATECASING(LEFTCAROLDANIELSA MESSAGE) AT 09:30AM, 8/15/04
RECIEVED 73 JTS 9 5/8"CASINGFROMBUNNING& S JTS FROM VERNALYARD,TOTALPIPE ON LOCATION3451'

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 35%SH, 25%SS, 10%SLTST, 30%LS
08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINAL CUTON 9 5/8". INSTALLED"B" SECTIONAND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.
07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RSTLOG WITH SCHLUMBERGERWHILENU BOP'S.
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g OWellName: STATE 01-32
Field: BIG SPRING

Property:055517

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTED BLIND RAMS, PIPE RAMS,FLOOR VALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATED VALVES TO250 & 5000 PSI.TESTED HYDRIL 250 & 2500 PSI WITH B&C QUICK TEST, ALL TESTS 10 MINUTES. TESTED CASING TO 1500PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.
16:00 17:00 LO SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEARBUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKE UP HYCALOGDSX210 JETTED
.85 TFA ON A HUNTING7/8 LOBE2.9 STAGE MOTORANDBHA. TRIPIN HOLE WITH SAME TO TOPOF CEMENT.

19:00 20:30 LS DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10'NEW HOLETO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMEDFIT TEST TO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENT WITH 8,4 PPGWATERIN HOLEAND 690 PSI. APPLIEDPSI,HELDFOR 15MIN, OK. BLED TO "O".
21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE WIMOTOR 3410' TO 3680' (270') 77.1'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.
00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @3598', 1/4DEG.
01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE3680' TO4115' (435') 87/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTINGINU BOP/CUT DRILL LINE
TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST, 35% LS
BGG34, CG 83, HG 465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days - 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATE W/MOTOR 4115' TO 4198'(83') 83'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1DEG.
07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL& ROTATE 4198' TO 4668' (470') 94'/HR, 18KWOB,57/46 RPM,250 DIFF.
12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', l 1/4 DEG.
13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL& ROTATE 4668' TO 5175' (507') 92.1'/HR, 20/22KWOB,57/46 RPM,200-250 DIFF.18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @5095', I 1/2 DEG.
19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL& ROTATE 5175' TO 6040' (865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20KWOB,57/46 RPM,200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:SLINGINGPIPE FROMTUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROMV--DOOR/SLICKLINE SURVEYS/BOPDRILL I MIN40 SEC
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION:WASATCH@4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15% SLTST, 5% LS
08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily TotalCum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Page

g OWellName: STATE 01-32
Field: BIG SPRING

Property:055517

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTED BLIND RAMS, PIPE RAMS,FLOOR VALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATED VALVES TO250 & 5000 PSI.TESTED HYDRIL 250 & 2500 PSI WITH B&C QUICK TEST, ALL TESTS 10 MINUTES. TESTED CASING TO 1500PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.
16:00 17:00 LO SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEARBUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKE UP HYCALOGDSX210 JETTED
.85 TFA ON A HUNTING7/8 LOBE2.9 STAGE MOTORANDBHA. TRIPIN HOLE WITH SAME TO TOPOF CEMENT.

19:00 20:30 LS DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10'NEW HOLETO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMEDFIT TEST TO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENT WITH 8,4 PPGWATERIN HOLEAND 690 PSI. APPLIEDPSI,HELDFOR 15MIN, OK. BLED TO "O".
21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE WIMOTOR 3410' TO 3680' (270') 77.1'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.
00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @3598', 1/4DEG.
01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE3680' TO4115' (435') 87/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTINGINU BOP/CUT DRILL LINE
TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST, 35% LS
BGG34, CG 83, HG 465
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Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATE W/MOTOR 4115' TO 4198'(83') 83'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1DEG.
07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL& ROTATE 4198' TO 4668' (470') 94'/HR, 18KWOB,57/46 RPM,250 DIFF.
12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', l 1/4 DEG.
13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL& ROTATE 4668' TO 5175' (507') 92.1'/HR, 20/22KWOB,57/46 RPM,200-250 DIFF.18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @5095', I 1/2 DEG.
19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL& ROTATE 5175' TO 6040' (865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20KWOB,57/46 RPM,200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:SLINGINGPIPE FROMTUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROMV--DOOR/SLICKLINE SURVEYS/BOPDRILL I MIN40 SEC
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION:WASATCH@4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15% SLTST, 5% LS
08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily TotalCum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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g OWellName: STATE 01-32
Field: BIG SPRING

Property:055517

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTED BLIND RAMS, PIPE RAMS,FLOOR VALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATED VALVES TO250 & 5000 PSI.TESTED HYDRIL 250 & 2500 PSI WITH B&C QUICK TEST, ALL TESTS 10 MINUTES. TESTED CASING TO 1500PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.
16:00 17:00 LO SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEARBUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKE UP HYCALOGDSX210 JETTED
.85 TFA ON A HUNTING7/8 LOBE2.9 STAGE MOTORANDBHA. TRIPIN HOLE WITH SAME TO TOPOF CEMENT.

19:00 20:30 LS DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10'NEW HOLETO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMEDFIT TEST TO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENT WITH 8,4 PPGWATERIN HOLEAND 690 PSI. APPLIEDPSI,HELDFOR 15MIN, OK. BLED TO "O".
21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE WIMOTOR 3410' TO 3680' (270') 77.1'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.
00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @3598', 1/4DEG.
01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE3680' TO4115' (435') 87/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTINGINU BOP/CUT DRILL LINE
TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST, 35% LS
BGG34, CG 83, HG 465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days - 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATE W/MOTOR 4115' TO 4198'(83') 83'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1DEG.
07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL& ROTATE 4198' TO 4668' (470') 94'/HR, 18KWOB,57/46 RPM,250 DIFF.
12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', l 1/4 DEG.
13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL& ROTATE 4668' TO 5175' (507') 92.1'/HR, 20/22KWOB,57/46 RPM,200-250 DIFF.18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @5095', I 1/2 DEG.
19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL& ROTATE 5175' TO 6040' (865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20KWOB,57/46 RPM,200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:SLINGINGPIPE FROMTUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROMV--DOOR/SLICKLINE SURVEYS/BOPDRILL I MIN40 SEC
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION:WASATCH@4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15% SLTST, 5% LS
08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily TotalCum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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« Wel1Name:STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATEWlMOTOR 6040' TO 6146'(106') 106'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46RPM,200-250 DIFF. BOP DRILLI MIN,40 SEC.
07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @6064', 1 3/4 DEG.
07:30 11:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE6146' TO 6451'(305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20KWOB, 57/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFR
11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTESTED HYDRILL, FLOOR VALVES& CHECKED CROWN-O--MATIC. BOP DRILLDAYS 1 MIN, 50 SEC.
12;00 23:30 11.5 DRILL ROTATE 6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.1'/HR, 18/22KWOB,22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.
23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY@7089', 1 DEG.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL & ROTATE7131' TO 7470' (339') 56.5'lHR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING: CHANGINGOIL/LOADINGAND UNLOADING/WORKING IN RAIN
TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION: NORTH HORN @6300', 65%SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST
08--20-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL & ROTATE W/MOTOR7470' TO 7809'(339') 48.4'/HR, 18/22KWOB, 22/57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTED PIPE RAMS,HYDRIL& CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC.
13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE 7809' TO 8384' (575') 34.8'/HR, 18/22KWOB,57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

STARTED LIGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETYMEETING:MIXING CHEMICAL/WORKING ONPUMPS
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: DARK CANYON TOP @8280', 79% SH, 20% SS, 10% SLTST
08-21-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL ROTATE 8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'lHR. 20/22KWOB, 57/46RPM, 100 DIFF.
08:00 I2:00 4.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY,PULLOUT OF HOLEFOR BIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAGON FIRST 5 STANDS,CLEANWITHNO DRAGAFTERTHAT.SURVEY@8400'- 2 DEG.
12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICERIG. FUNCTION TEST BLINDS,RAMS, CHOKE,FLOORVALVES.

Page

« Wel1Name:STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATEWlMOTOR 6040' TO 6146'(106') 106'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46RPM,200-250 DIFF. BOP DRILLI MIN,40 SEC.
07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @6064', 1 3/4 DEG.
07:30 11:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE6146' TO 6451'(305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20KWOB, 57/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFR
11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTESTED HYDRILL, FLOOR VALVES& CHECKED CROWN-O--MATIC. BOP DRILLDAYS 1 MIN, 50 SEC.
12;00 23:30 11.5 DRILL ROTATE 6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.1'/HR, 18/22KWOB,22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.
23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY@7089', 1 DEG.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL & ROTATE7131' TO 7470' (339') 56.5'lHR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING: CHANGINGOIL/LOADINGAND UNLOADING/WORKING IN RAIN
TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION: NORTH HORN @6300', 65%SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST
08--20-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL & ROTATE W/MOTOR7470' TO 7809'(339') 48.4'/HR, 18/22KWOB, 22/57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTED PIPE RAMS,HYDRIL& CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC.
13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE 7809' TO 8384' (575') 34.8'/HR, 18/22KWOB,57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

STARTED LIGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETYMEETING:MIXING CHEMICAL/WORKING ONPUMPS
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: DARK CANYON TOP @8280', 79% SH, 20% SS, 10% SLTST
08-21-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL ROTATE 8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'lHR. 20/22KWOB, 57/46RPM, 100 DIFF.
08:00 I2:00 4.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY,PULLOUT OF HOLEFOR BIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAGON FIRST 5 STANDS,CLEANWITHNO DRAGAFTERTHAT.SURVEY@8400'- 2 DEG.
12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICERIG. FUNCTION TEST BLINDS,RAMS, CHOKE,FLOORVALVES.
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« Wel1Name:STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATEWlMOTOR 6040' TO 6146'(106') 106'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46RPM,200-250 DIFF. BOP DRILLI MIN,40 SEC.
07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @6064', 1 3/4 DEG.
07:30 11:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE6146' TO 6451'(305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20KWOB, 57/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFR
11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTESTED HYDRILL, FLOOR VALVES& CHECKED CROWN-O--MATIC. BOP DRILLDAYS 1 MIN, 50 SEC.
12;00 23:30 11.5 DRILL ROTATE 6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.1'/HR, 18/22KWOB,22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.
23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY@7089', 1 DEG.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL & ROTATE7131' TO 7470' (339') 56.5'lHR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING: CHANGINGOIL/LOADINGAND UNLOADING/WORKING IN RAIN
TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION: NORTH HORN @6300', 65%SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST
08--20-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL & ROTATE W/MOTOR7470' TO 7809'(339') 48.4'/HR, 18/22KWOB, 22/57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTED PIPE RAMS,HYDRIL& CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC.
13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE 7809' TO 8384' (575') 34.8'/HR, 18/22KWOB,57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

STARTED LIGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETYMEETING:MIXING CHEMICAL/WORKING ONPUMPS
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: DARK CANYON TOP @8280', 79% SH, 20% SS, 10% SLTST
08-21-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL ROTATE 8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'lHR. 20/22KWOB, 57/46RPM, 100 DIFF.
08:00 I2:00 4.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY,PULLOUT OF HOLEFOR BIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAGON FIRST 5 STANDS,CLEANWITHNO DRAGAFTERTHAT.SURVEY@8400'- 2 DEG.
12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICERIG. FUNCTION TEST BLINDS,RAMS, CHOKE,FLOORVALVES.
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Wel1Name: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 - HTC HCSO6Z JETTED WITH 0.66" TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT.ROLLER REAMERS(ONE AT 30' &OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGE BUTTON CUTTERS ON EACH, TRIP TNHOLEWITHSAME.
16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30' OF FILLON BOTTOM.PATTERNBIT.
16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL 8429' TO 9090' (661') 48.9'/HR. 28/30K WOB,58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNING WATERAROUND ELECTICAL OUTLETS,TRIPPING, IMPORTANCE OF USINGSTATICLINE.

WEATHER: 58 DEG. PARTLY CLOUDY,CALM

FORMATION: PRICE RIVER TOP@8549', 40%SH,50% SS, 10% SLTST,
BGG-30, CG-52, TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion We11Total
MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') 55.6'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.
I 1:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY @9326' -- 2 1/4 DEG.
12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM. RAISE WT.TO 9.5 PPGAT 9400'
17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICERIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.
17:30 18:00 0.5 CHANGE OUTROTATING HEAD INSERT ANDFLOW SENSOR.
18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL9675' TO 10195'(520') 43.3'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM. INCRMW SLOWLYTO 10 PPGPRIOR TOTHEBLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING:HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRELINE SURVEYS.
WEATHER53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST@3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST,20% CARB SH.
BGG 3747,CG 1306, HIGHGAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 Mw 10.5 Visc 40.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195'TO 1022T (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.
08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227' TO 10250' (23') 5.l'/HR. 14/30K WOB, 58 RPM,
12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY,PULLOUT OF HOLEFOR BIT#4. BIT WORNFLAT ON SHOULDER TOMATRIX. INNERCUTTERSIN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAMS.
17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSXl46HGJW ANDTRIP IN HOLETO CASINGSHOE.
20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP & CUT DRILLLINE.
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Wel1Name: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 - HTC HCSO6Z JETTED WITH 0.66" TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT.ROLLER REAMERS(ONE AT 30' &OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGE BUTTON CUTTERS ON EACH, TRIP TNHOLEWITHSAME.
16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30' OF FILLON BOTTOM.PATTERNBIT.
16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL 8429' TO 9090' (661') 48.9'/HR. 28/30K WOB,58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNING WATERAROUND ELECTICAL OUTLETS,TRIPPING, IMPORTANCE OF USINGSTATICLINE.

WEATHER: 58 DEG. PARTLY CLOUDY,CALM

FORMATION: PRICE RIVER TOP@8549', 40%SH,50% SS, 10% SLTST,
BGG-30, CG-52, TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion We11Total
MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') 55.6'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.
I 1:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY @9326' -- 2 1/4 DEG.
12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM. RAISE WT.TO 9.5 PPGAT 9400'
17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICERIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.
17:30 18:00 0.5 CHANGE OUTROTATING HEAD INSERT ANDFLOW SENSOR.
18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL9675' TO 10195'(520') 43.3'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM. INCRMW SLOWLYTO 10 PPGPRIOR TOTHEBLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING:HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRELINE SURVEYS.
WEATHER53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST@3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST,20% CARB SH.
BGG 3747,CG 1306, HIGHGAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 Mw 10.5 Visc 40.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195'TO 1022T (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.
08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227' TO 10250' (23') 5.l'/HR. 14/30K WOB, 58 RPM,
12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY,PULLOUT OF HOLEFOR BIT#4. BIT WORNFLAT ON SHOULDER TOMATRIX. INNERCUTTERSIN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAMS.
17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSXl46HGJW ANDTRIP IN HOLETO CASINGSHOE.
20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP & CUT DRILLLINE.
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Wel1Name: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 - HTC HCSO6Z JETTED WITH 0.66" TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT.ROLLER REAMERS(ONE AT 30' &OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGE BUTTON CUTTERS ON EACH, TRIP TNHOLEWITHSAME.
16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30' OF FILLON BOTTOM.PATTERNBIT.
16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL 8429' TO 9090' (661') 48.9'/HR. 28/30K WOB,58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNING WATERAROUND ELECTICAL OUTLETS,TRIPPING, IMPORTANCE OF USINGSTATICLINE.

WEATHER: 58 DEG. PARTLY CLOUDY,CALM

FORMATION: PRICE RIVER TOP@8549', 40%SH,50% SS, 10% SLTST,
BGG-30, CG-52, TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion We11Total
MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') 55.6'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.
I 1:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY @9326' -- 2 1/4 DEG.
12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM. RAISE WT.TO 9.5 PPGAT 9400'
17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICERIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.
17:30 18:00 0.5 CHANGE OUTROTATING HEAD INSERT ANDFLOW SENSOR.
18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL9675' TO 10195'(520') 43.3'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM. INCRMW SLOWLYTO 10 PPGPRIOR TOTHEBLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING:HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRELINE SURVEYS.
WEATHER53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST@3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST,20% CARB SH.
BGG 3747,CG 1306, HIGHGAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 Mw 10.5 Visc 40.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195'TO 1022T (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.
08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227' TO 10250' (23') 5.l'/HR. 14/30K WOB, 58 RPM,
12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY,PULLOUT OF HOLEFOR BIT#4. BIT WORNFLAT ON SHOULDER TOMATRIX. INNERCUTTERSIN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAMS.
17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSXl46HGJW ANDTRIP IN HOLETO CASINGSHOE.
20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP & CUT DRILLLINE.
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WellName: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISHIN HOLEFILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.
01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM71' TO BOTTOMSLOWLY. TORQUEYLAST20'.
02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'/HR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:CHAINS, HOSES, ETC.AROUND ROTARY TABLE, TRIPPINGAND CUTTINGDRILLLINE.
WEATHER: 57 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST@5 MPH.

FORMATION:BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 50% SH, 35% SS, 5 % SLTST, 10% CARB SH.
BGG 2353, CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280,HIGH GAS5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling

. Completion Well Total
MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304'(14') 9.3'/HR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGED SWAB & SEAT IN PUMPS,
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304'TO 10,350'(46') 13.l'/HR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.
I1:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRIL & FLOOR VALVES.
12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350'TO 10,708'(358') 19.8'/HR,16/18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKING ON PUMPS
TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWERPRICERIVER @10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, 5% SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL
BOG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES >1'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 S.0 DRILL 10,708' TO l0,846'(138') 27.6'/HR, 18K WOB,55 RPM.
11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS,HYDRILAND HCR.
11:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846'TO 11,046'(200') 10.8'lHR, 18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG
TEMP 50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP@10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10%CARB SH, 10%COAL
BGG 2799, CG 5849,HIGHGAS 4269
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WellName: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISHIN HOLEFILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.
01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM71' TO BOTTOMSLOWLY. TORQUEYLAST20'.
02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'/HR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:CHAINS, HOSES, ETC.AROUND ROTARY TABLE, TRIPPINGAND CUTTINGDRILLLINE.
WEATHER: 57 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST@5 MPH.

FORMATION:BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 50% SH, 35% SS, 5 % SLTST, 10% CARB SH.
BGG 2353, CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280,HIGH GAS5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling

. Completion Well Total
MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304'(14') 9.3'/HR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGED SWAB & SEAT IN PUMPS,
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304'TO 10,350'(46') 13.l'/HR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.
I1:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRIL & FLOOR VALVES.
12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350'TO 10,708'(358') 19.8'/HR,16/18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKING ON PUMPS
TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWERPRICERIVER @10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, 5% SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL
BOG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES >1'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 S.0 DRILL 10,708' TO l0,846'(138') 27.6'/HR, 18K WOB,55 RPM.
11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS,HYDRILAND HCR.
11:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846'TO 11,046'(200') 10.8'lHR, 18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG
TEMP 50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP@10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10%CARB SH, 10%COAL
BGG 2799, CG 5849,HIGHGAS 4269
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WellName: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISHIN HOLEFILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.
01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM71' TO BOTTOMSLOWLY. TORQUEYLAST20'.
02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'/HR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:CHAINS, HOSES, ETC.AROUND ROTARY TABLE, TRIPPINGAND CUTTINGDRILLLINE.
WEATHER: 57 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST@5 MPH.

FORMATION:BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 50% SH, 35% SS, 5 % SLTST, 10% CARB SH.
BGG 2353, CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280,HIGH GAS5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling

. Completion Well Total
MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304'(14') 9.3'/HR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGED SWAB & SEAT IN PUMPS,
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304'TO 10,350'(46') 13.l'/HR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.
I1:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRIL & FLOOR VALVES.
12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350'TO 10,708'(358') 19.8'/HR,16/18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKING ON PUMPS
TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWERPRICERIVER @10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, 5% SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL
BOG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES >1'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 S.0 DRILL 10,708' TO l0,846'(138') 27.6'/HR, 18K WOB,55 RPM.
11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS,HYDRILAND HCR.
11:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846'TO 11,046'(200') 10.8'lHR, 18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG
TEMP 50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP@10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10%CARB SH, 10%COAL
BGG 2799, CG 5849,HIGHGAS 4269
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- WellName: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLOR/CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Vise 45.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL 11,046' TO ll,146'(100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB, 57 RPM.
17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPED SLUG. DROPPED SURVEY. TOH FOR BIT #5, NOTIGHT SPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE, INNER STRUCTUREGOOD, WORN CUTTERS AND FLATTENED CUTTERS ON OUTSIDE.
23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKE UP BIT #5, HTCHC506ZAND TIH. WASHED & REAMEDLAST 20' WITHOUT MUCH TORQUE.
05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL 11,146'TO ll,l60'(14') 14 FPH,WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: BLACKHAWKTOP @11,112', 35%SH, 50%SS, S%SLTST,10% CARB SH, COAL < 5%
BGG 2200, TRIP GAS6000

08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling .

. Completion Well Total
MD I1,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW I1.1 Visc 44.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160' TO 11,650'(490') 20 FPH, WOB 18K, 56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETYMEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: SUNNYSIDETOP @l1,370', 20% SH, 65%SS, 10% SLTST, 5% CARB SH
BG GAS 3284U, CONNGAS Sl54U

08-28-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW 11.0 Visc 43.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RUN OPENHOLELOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL 11650'- 11700' TD. REACHED TD @09:30,8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH, WOB 19K,56 RPM, PP 1550.
09:30 1l:00 1.5 CIRCULATEDFOR SHORT TRIP.
1l:00 12:00 1.0 SHORTTRIP 15STANDS,NO DRAGOR FILL.
12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATED TRIPGAS OUT, 6900 UNITS. PUMPED PILL
14:00 19:00 5.0 TOHFOR LOGS. SCHLUMBERGER ONLOCATION @17:00.
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- WellName: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLOR/CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Vise 45.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL 11,046' TO ll,146'(100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB, 57 RPM.
17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPED SLUG. DROPPED SURVEY. TOH FOR BIT #5, NOTIGHT SPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE, INNER STRUCTUREGOOD, WORN CUTTERS AND FLATTENED CUTTERS ON OUTSIDE.
23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKE UP BIT #5, HTCHC506ZAND TIH. WASHED & REAMEDLAST 20' WITHOUT MUCH TORQUE.
05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL 11,146'TO ll,l60'(14') 14 FPH,WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: BLACKHAWKTOP @11,112', 35%SH, 50%SS, S%SLTST,10% CARB SH, COAL < 5%
BGG 2200, TRIP GAS6000

08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling .

. Completion Well Total
MD I1,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW I1.1 Visc 44.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160' TO 11,650'(490') 20 FPH, WOB 18K, 56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETYMEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: SUNNYSIDETOP @l1,370', 20% SH, 65%SS, 10% SLTST, 5% CARB SH
BG GAS 3284U, CONNGAS Sl54U

08-28-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW 11.0 Visc 43.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RUN OPENHOLELOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL 11650'- 11700' TD. REACHED TD @09:30,8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH, WOB 19K,56 RPM, PP 1550.
09:30 1l:00 1.5 CIRCULATEDFOR SHORT TRIP.
1l:00 12:00 1.0 SHORTTRIP 15STANDS,NO DRAGOR FILL.
12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATED TRIPGAS OUT, 6900 UNITS. PUMPED PILL
14:00 19:00 5.0 TOHFOR LOGS. SCHLUMBERGER ONLOCATION @17:00.
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- WellName: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLOR/CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Vise 45.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL 11,046' TO ll,146'(100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB, 57 RPM.
17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPED SLUG. DROPPED SURVEY. TOH FOR BIT #5, NOTIGHT SPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE, INNER STRUCTUREGOOD, WORN CUTTERS AND FLATTENED CUTTERS ON OUTSIDE.
23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKE UP BIT #5, HTCHC506ZAND TIH. WASHED & REAMEDLAST 20' WITHOUT MUCH TORQUE.
05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL 11,146'TO ll,l60'(14') 14 FPH,WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: BLACKHAWKTOP @11,112', 35%SH, 50%SS, S%SLTST,10% CARB SH, COAL < 5%
BGG 2200, TRIP GAS6000

08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling .

. Completion Well Total
MD I1,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW I1.1 Visc 44.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160' TO 11,650'(490') 20 FPH, WOB 18K, 56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETYMEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: SUNNYSIDETOP @l1,370', 20% SH, 65%SS, 10% SLTST, 5% CARB SH
BG GAS 3284U, CONNGAS Sl54U

08-28-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW 11.0 Visc 43.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RUN OPENHOLELOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL 11650'- 11700' TD. REACHED TD @09:30,8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH, WOB 19K,56 RPM, PP 1550.
09:30 1l:00 1.5 CIRCULATEDFOR SHORT TRIP.
1l:00 12:00 1.0 SHORTTRIP 15STANDS,NO DRAGOR FILL.
12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATED TRIPGAS OUT, 6900 UNITS. PUMPED PILL
14:00 19:00 5.0 TOHFOR LOGS. SCHLUMBERGER ONLOCATION @17:00.
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. Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETYMEETING. RUSCHLUMBERGER.LOGGINGWELL. LOGSRUN: PLATFORM EXPRESSWITHDIPOLE SONIC FROM TD TO BASE OF INT CASING. ROTARY SIDEWALL COR.ES IN NEXT RUNS.

SAFETYMEETING: LOGGING
08-29-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.0 Vise 44.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FISHINGROTARY CORINGTOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGW/SCHLUMBERGER. FINISHED RUNNINGPLATFORM EXPRESS& DIPOLE SONIC, LOGGERSTDWAS I1,706'.
07:00 09:00 2.0 WAIT ON ORDERS (CORE POINTS OFFOF LOGS). RECEIVED CORE POINTSFROM GEOLOGYDEPT.
09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARY SIDEWALL CORE TOOL,MADEONE CORE @ l I,653'AND WASSTUCK.
12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKEDTOOL,TRIED TO GET FREE WITHNO PROGRESSWHILEWAITINGON WEATHERFORDFISHERMAN & TOOLS.
17:00 20:00 3.0 RU WEATHERFORD TO STRIP OVER WIRELINE AND FISHTOOL SAFETYMEETING:DON'T GET IN AHURRY.
20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPING OVER WIRELINE, CAME LOOSE @4185'.
01:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINE TOGETHERAND PULLED TOOL INTOOVERSHOT.
04:00 06:00 2.0 PULLED LINE OUT OF TOOL AND POH W/ELECTRIC CABLE.

SAFETYMEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTED CAROLDANIELS W/UOGM AT 10:30 AM, 8/26/04 TO NOTIFY OF PRODUCTIONCASINGCEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTEDDAN JARVIS(LEFT MESSAGE, NO AFTER--HOURS NUMBER) W/UTAHDNRAT ll:30 AM, 8-27-04 W/NOTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT, SLURRY & UPDATED TIMINGFOR PRODUCTION CEMENT JOB.
08-30-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW I 1.0 Visc 44.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 TOH WlDP, FISHINGTOOLS& CORETOOL(FISH). LD FISH.
09:00 10:00 1.0 BlŒAK DOWN FISHINGTOOLS,REMOVED WEAR BUSHING.
10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH W/TRF-CONE BIT TO CLEANOUT ANDCONDITIONEHOLEFOR CASING, 4' FILL.
15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATED ANDCONDITIONED HOLE FORCASING.
17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETYMEETING. RIG UP WESTATESCASINGSERVICE. LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE.
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. Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETYMEETING. RUSCHLUMBERGER.LOGGINGWELL. LOGSRUN: PLATFORM EXPRESSWITHDIPOLE SONIC FROM TD TO BASE OF INT CASING. ROTARY SIDEWALL COR.ES IN NEXT RUNS.

SAFETYMEETING: LOGGING
08-29-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.0 Vise 44.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FISHINGROTARY CORINGTOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGW/SCHLUMBERGER. FINISHED RUNNINGPLATFORM EXPRESS& DIPOLE SONIC, LOGGERSTDWAS I1,706'.
07:00 09:00 2.0 WAIT ON ORDERS (CORE POINTS OFFOF LOGS). RECEIVED CORE POINTSFROM GEOLOGYDEPT.
09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARY SIDEWALL CORE TOOL,MADEONE CORE @ l I,653'AND WASSTUCK.
12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKEDTOOL,TRIED TO GET FREE WITHNO PROGRESSWHILEWAITINGON WEATHERFORDFISHERMAN & TOOLS.
17:00 20:00 3.0 RU WEATHERFORD TO STRIP OVER WIRELINE AND FISHTOOL SAFETYMEETING:DON'T GET IN AHURRY.

20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPING OVER WIRELINE, CAME LOOSE @4185'.
01:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINE TOGETHERAND PULLED TOOL INTOOVERSHOT.
04:00 06:00 2.0 PULLED LINE OUT OF TOOL AND POH W/ELECTRIC CABLE.

SAFETYMEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTED CAROLDANIELS W/UOGM AT 10:30 AM, 8/26/04 TO NOTIFY OF PRODUCTIONCASINGCEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTEDDAN JARVIS(LEFT MESSAGE, NO AFTER--HOURS NUMBER) W/UTAHDNRAT ll:30 AM, 8-27-04 W/NOTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT, SLURRY & UPDATED TIMINGFOR PRODUCTION CEMENT JOB.
08-30-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW I 1.0 Visc 44.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 TOH WlDP, FISHINGTOOLS& CORETOOL(FISH). LD FISH.
09:00 10:00 1.0 BlŒAK DOWN FISHINGTOOLS,REMOVED WEAR BUSHING.
10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH W/TRF-CONE BIT TO CLEANOUT ANDCONDITIONEHOLEFOR CASING, 4' FILL.
15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATED ANDCONDITIONED HOLE FORCASING.
17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETYMEETING. RIG UP WESTATESCASINGSERVICE. LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE.
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. Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETYMEETING. RUSCHLUMBERGER.LOGGINGWELL. LOGSRUN: PLATFORM EXPRESSWITHDIPOLE SONIC FROM TD TO BASE OF INT CASING. ROTARY SIDEWALL COR.ES IN NEXT RUNS.

SAFETYMEETING: LOGGING
08-29-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.0 Vise 44.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FISHINGROTARY CORINGTOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGW/SCHLUMBERGER. FINISHED RUNNINGPLATFORM EXPRESS& DIPOLE SONIC, LOGGERSTDWAS I1,706'.
07:00 09:00 2.0 WAIT ON ORDERS (CORE POINTS OFFOF LOGS). RECEIVED CORE POINTSFROM GEOLOGYDEPT.
09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARY SIDEWALL CORE TOOL,MADEONE CORE @ l I,653'AND WASSTUCK.
12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKEDTOOL,TRIED TO GET FREE WITHNO PROGRESSWHILEWAITINGON WEATHERFORDFISHERMAN & TOOLS.
17:00 20:00 3.0 RU WEATHERFORD TO STRIP OVER WIRELINE AND FISHTOOL SAFETYMEETING:DON'T GET IN AHURRY.

20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPING OVER WIRELINE, CAME LOOSE @4185'.
01:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINE TOGETHERAND PULLED TOOL INTOOVERSHOT.
04:00 06:00 2.0 PULLED LINE OUT OF TOOL AND POH W/ELECTRIC CABLE.

SAFETYMEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTED CAROLDANIELS W/UOGM AT 10:30 AM, 8/26/04 TO NOTIFY OF PRODUCTIONCASINGCEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTEDDAN JARVIS(LEFT MESSAGE, NO AFTER--HOURS NUMBER) W/UTAHDNRAT ll:30 AM, 8-27-04 W/NOTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT, SLURRY & UPDATED TIMINGFOR PRODUCTION CEMENT JOB.
08-30-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW I 1.0 Visc 44.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 TOH WlDP, FISHINGTOOLS& CORETOOL(FISH). LD FISH.
09:00 10:00 1.0 BlŒAK DOWN FISHINGTOOLS,REMOVED WEAR BUSHING.
10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH W/TRF-CONE BIT TO CLEANOUT ANDCONDITIONEHOLEFOR CASING, 4' FILL.
15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATED ANDCONDITIONED HOLE FORCASING.
17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETYMEETING. RIG UP WESTATESCASINGSERVICE. LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE.
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, Well Name: STATE01-32
Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

02:00 06:00 4.0 RUWESTATES CASINGTOOLS. SAFETYMEETING. RUN4 1/2", 116#, P-110, LTCCASINGAS FOLLOWS:FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, CASING. CENTRALIZERS ON MIDDLE FIRST JOINT, EVERYOTHER JOINT TO 8800' (37 TOTAL). MARKER JOINTS@901l'AND 6336'. (4100' OF CASING PICKEDUP @REPORT TIME).

SAFETY MEETING:LD DRILLPIPE
08-31-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 FINISHED RUNNINGTOTAL OF 293 JOINTS(291FULL JTS + 2 - 20' MARKERJOINTS) OF 4 1/2", 11.6#, HC P-110, LTC CASING. SHOE DEPTH 11,695', FLOAT COLLAR 11,652', 20' MARKER JTS 8989-9009' & 6334-6354'.NO TIGHT SPOTS OR FILL. STRINGWEIGHT112,000#BEFORE CEMENTING.
09:00 11:00 2.0 CIRCULATED FOR CEMENT.

11:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGERIDOWELLTO CEMENT.SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINESTO 5,000 PSLPUMP JOB AS FOLLOWS: 20 BBLSMUD FLUSH,20 BBLS H2OAHEAD,LEADSLURRY: 713 SX (2182CU/FT)GHI LIFT, 3.05 YLD, I 1.5 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H2O,+ 12% DO20 +1% D079 +
.2% DI67 +

.2% DO46+ 2% D013 + .25#/SK DO29.TAILSLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, 1.29YLD, 14.1 PPG,5.96 GAL/SKH2O,+ 2%D020 +
.1% 0046 + .1% D0l3 + .2% D167 +

.2% D065. DROPPED PLUGAND DISPLACED W/185.8 BBL H2O.MAX PRESSURE2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUGTO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK.2 BBL,FLOATS HELD. RDSCHLUMBERGERIDOWELL. PU BOP AND SET SLIPSW/80,000 LBS (NO BLOCK WEIGHT). ESTTOP OFCEMENT4,000'.
15:00 18:00 3.0 CLEANEDMUD TANKS.
18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVINGRIGTO STAGECOACHUNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORTUNTILCOMPLETIONCOMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.

DIESEL TRANSFERREDTO STAGECOACHUNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS@$1.40/GAL
09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10MBOPE. RU CUTTERSWL. RaN CBL/VDL/GR/CCL FROM PBTD TO 8000' & ACROSS CEMENT TOP @3550'. RDWL. PRESSURETESTED CASING, BOPE & FLOWEQUIPMENT TO 8500PSIG FOR 15 MIN. SDFN,09-04--2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
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, Well Name: STATE01-32
Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

02:00 06:00 4.0 RUWESTATES CASINGTOOLS. SAFETYMEETING. RUN4 1/2", 116#, P-110, LTCCASINGAS FOLLOWS:FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, CASING. CENTRALIZERS ON MIDDLE FIRST JOINT, EVERYOTHER JOINT TO 8800' (37 TOTAL). MARKER JOINTS@901l'AND 6336'. (4100' OF CASING PICKEDUP @REPORT TIME).

SAFETY MEETING:LD DRILLPIPE
08-31-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 FINISHED RUNNINGTOTAL OF 293 JOINTS(291FULL JTS + 2 - 20' MARKERJOINTS) OF 4 1/2", 11.6#, HC P-110, LTC CASING. SHOE DEPTH 11,695', FLOAT COLLAR 11,652', 20' MARKER JTS 8989-9009' & 6334-6354'.NO TIGHT SPOTS OR FILL. STRINGWEIGHT112,000#BEFORE CEMENTING.
09:00 11:00 2.0 CIRCULATED FOR CEMENT.

11:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGERIDOWELLTO CEMENT.SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINESTO 5,000 PSLPUMP JOB AS FOLLOWS: 20 BBLSMUD FLUSH,20 BBLS H2OAHEAD,LEADSLURRY: 713 SX (2182CU/FT)GHI LIFT, 3.05 YLD, I 1.5 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H2O,+ 12% DO20 +1% D079 +
.2% DI67 +

.2% DO46+ 2% D013 + .25#/SK DO29.TAILSLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, 1.29YLD, 14.1 PPG,5.96 GAL/SKH2O,+ 2%D020 +
.1% 0046 + .1% D0l3 + .2% D167 +

.2% D065. DROPPED PLUGAND DISPLACED W/185.8 BBL H2O.MAX PRESSURE2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUGTO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK.2 BBL,FLOATS HELD. RDSCHLUMBERGERIDOWELL. PU BOP AND SET SLIPSW/80,000 LBS (NO BLOCK WEIGHT). ESTTOP OFCEMENT4,000'.
15:00 18:00 3.0 CLEANEDMUD TANKS.
18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVINGRIGTO STAGECOACHUNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORTUNTILCOMPLETIONCOMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.

DIESEL TRANSFERREDTO STAGECOACHUNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS@$1.40/GAL
09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10MBOPE. RU CUTTERSWL. RaN CBL/VDL/GR/CCL FROM PBTD TO 8000' & ACROSS CEMENT TOP @3550'. RDWL. PRESSURETESTED CASING, BOPE & FLOWEQUIPMENT TO 8500PSIG FOR 15 MIN. SDFN,09-04--2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
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08-31-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
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.2% D065. DROPPED PLUGAND DISPLACED W/185.8 BBL H2O.MAX PRESSURE2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUGTO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK.2 BBL,FLOATS HELD. RDSCHLUMBERGERIDOWELL. PU BOP AND SET SLIPSW/80,000 LBS (NO BLOCK WEIGHT). ESTTOP OFCEMENT4,000'.
15:00 18:00 3.0 CLEANEDMUD TANKS.
18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVINGRIGTO STAGECOACHUNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORTUNTILCOMPLETIONCOMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.

DIESEL TRANSFERREDTO STAGECOACHUNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS@$1.40/GAL
09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10MBOPE. RU CUTTERSWL. RaN CBL/VDL/GR/CCL FROM PBTD TO 8000' & ACROSS CEMENT TOP @3550'. RDWL. PRESSURETESTED CASING, BOPE & FLOWEQUIPMENT TO 8500PSIG FOR 15 MIN. SDFN,09-04--2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
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g O- Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIGSPRING Property:055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATED SUNNYSIDEFROM l l391'-93', 11406'-09', 11433'-34', I1462'--63', 11485'--87'& 11503'-05' W/3-l/8" HSC PORTED CASING GUNS @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL.

RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASINGW/4959 GAL YFl25ST PAD, 45,381 GALYF125ST & YF118ST&168,556#20/40 SAND @1--6PPG. MTP 8348PSIG. MTR51.1 BPM. ATP 6671 PSIG. ATR46.2 BPM. ISIP 4200PSlG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@11323'. PERFORATEDBLACKHAWKFROM11122'-25', 11153-
55', 11229'-30', 11249'-50', 11274'-76' & 11289'-91' @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL RU SCHLUMBERGER.FRACDOWN CASING W/4973 GAL YF125ST PAD,58580 GAL YFl25ST & YF118ST & 243,775#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8381 PSIG. MTR49.7 BPM. ATP5671 PSlG. ATR42.8 BPM. ISIP 5600 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 16 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIG. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED 1110 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.
09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I1652.0 Perf: 1I122--11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200 PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED 920 BLW. 1220 BLWTR,

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARING BETWEENFLUIDSLUGS. MINIMALCONDENSATE. RECOVERED790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : l l122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06;00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 150 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 265 BLW. 525 BLWTR.

09-08-2004 Reported Ry HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion 513,360 Daily Total $13,360
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g O- WellName: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RUNPRODUCTIONTUBING
Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 252 BLW. 273 BLWTR.

MIRUDUCORIG #3. SDFN.
09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE& BLACKHAWK ZONES
Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUBTO 11,323'. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUG @l1,323'. RIH. FILL@I1,469'. CLEANED OUTTO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCESin4 DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

U 1 UT ST ML-48380
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:

Do notuse thisfonn for poposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells beloW Current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillborizontal latemis. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STATE 1-32
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4304735839
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
P.O. BOX250 BIG PINEY WY 83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL - 2067' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work wllistan: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of woi completion;

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: DRILLING
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION OPERATIONS

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearlyshowallpertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Please see the attached well chronology report for drillingoperations from 8/07/2004 - 10/01/2004.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Alfreda Schulz TITLE Sr. Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE 10/1/2004

(This space for Stato use only)

RECEIVED
OCT0 6 2004

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DN.OFOlL,GAS&
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Do notuse thisfonn for poposals to drillnew wells, significantly deepen existing wells beloW Current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillborizontal latemis. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STATE 1-32
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4304735839
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
P.O. BOX250 BIG PINEY WY 83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL - 2067' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work wllistan: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of woi completion;

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: DRILLING
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION OPERATIONS

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearlyshowallpertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Please see the attached well chronology report for drillingoperations from 8/07/2004 - 10/01/2004.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Alfreda Schulz TITLE Sr. Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE 10/1/2004

(This space for Stato use only)

RECEIVED
OCT0 6 2004

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DN.OFOlL,GAS&



O

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORTg resources he

own enow e en Report Generated On: 10-01-2004

Well Name STATE 01-32 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIG SPRING API # 43447-35839 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/ 11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/ 5,571

Location Section32, T105, R18E, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOGRESOURCES,INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total DHC / CWC

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-23--2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total 50

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2152' FNL& 206T FWL(SE/NW)

SECTION 32, T10S, R18E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

TD: I 1,700' BLACKHAWK

TRUE RIG #9

WC/GAS
BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML- 48380

ELEVATION: 5572'NAT GL, 5571' PREP GL, 5585' KB (14')

EOGWI 50%,NRI 43.75%
DOMINION EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIETROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completit Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :

O

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORTg resources he

own enow e en Report Generated On: 10-01-2004

Well Name STATE 01-32 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIG SPRING API # 43447-35839 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/ 11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/ 5,571

Location Section32, T105, R18E, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOGRESOURCES,INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total DHC / CWC

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-23--2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total 50

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2152' FNL& 206T FWL(SE/NW)

SECTION 32, T10S, R18E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

TD: I 1,700' BLACKHAWK

TRUE RIG #9

WC/GAS
BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML- 48380

ELEVATION: 5572'NAT GL, 5571' PREP GL, 5585' KB (14')

EOGWI 50%,NRI 43.75%
DOMINION EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIETROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completit Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :

O

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORTg resources he

own enow e en Report Generated On: 10-01-2004

Well Name STATE 01-32 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIG SPRING API # 43447-35839 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/ 11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/ 5,571

Location Section32, T105, R18E, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOGRESOURCES,INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total DHC / CWC

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-23--2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total 50

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2152' FNL& 206T FWL(SE/NW)

SECTION 32, T10S, R18E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

TD: I 1,700' BLACKHAWK

TRUE RIG #9

WC/GAS
BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML- 48380

ELEVATION: 5572'NAT GL, 5571' PREP GL, 5585' KB (14')

EOGWI 50%,NRI 43.75%
DOMINION EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIETROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completit Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :



Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUCRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17½ "HOLE@ 3:00 PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED 17 1/2"HOLETO 230'. RAN 5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#/FT,H-40, ST&CCASING& LANDED@
238.90' KB. RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. PRESSURETESTEDLINESAND CEMENT VALVE TU 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED20 BBLS GELLEDWATER& 20 BBLSWATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT. MIXED& PUMPED 225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENTW/2%CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT@15.8PPGW/YIELDOF l.15
CF/SX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT W/29 BBLSWATER & SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE.HAD 12 BBLS
CEMENT RETURNS TO SURFACE. RD BIG4. PREPAREDLOCATIONFOR RUTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP
FROMREPORTUNTIL FURTHERACTIVITY,

EDTROTTER NOTIFIEDCAROLDANIELSWlUOGM OF SPUDDINGWELL AT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 1,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRUTRUERIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER,HCRANDHOOKUP CHOKE LINES.

13:30 14:30 1.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHP51 BIT, 5/6 LOBE4 STAGE MOTOR,SHOCKSUBAND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT 214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP 214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30 1.0. DRILLROTATE229' TO 285' (56') 56'IHR. 18/20K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTIONTESTDIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 285' TO 350' (65') 65'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICERIG.

18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588' (238') 47.6'lHR. 22/25K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @503', 3/4 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL ROTATE 588' TO 1005' (417') 69.5'lHR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIGON DAYWORK 10:00 AM, 8/12/04

NOTIF1EDUTAHDNR (CARROLDANIELS)OF INTENT TO SPUD @08:30 8/12/04

FUELATSTARTOF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETYMEETlNG: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNINGSLICK LINE SURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD7-7/8" HOLEAT3:30 PM, 8/12/04

08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Page

Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUCRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17½ "HOLE@ 3:00 PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED 17 1/2"HOLETO 230'. RAN 5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#/FT,H-40, ST&CCASING& LANDED@
238.90' KB. RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. PRESSURETESTEDLINESAND CEMENT VALVE TU 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED20 BBLS GELLEDWATER& 20 BBLSWATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT. MIXED& PUMPED 225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENTW/2%CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT@15.8PPGW/YIELDOF l.15
CF/SX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT W/29 BBLSWATER & SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE.HAD 12 BBLS
CEMENT RETURNS TO SURFACE. RD BIG4. PREPAREDLOCATIONFOR RUTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP
FROMREPORTUNTIL FURTHERACTIVITY,

EDTROTTER NOTIFIEDCAROLDANIELSWlUOGM OF SPUDDINGWELL AT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 1,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRUTRUERIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER,HCRANDHOOKUP CHOKE LINES.

13:30 14:30 1.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHP51 BIT, 5/6 LOBE4 STAGE MOTOR,SHOCKSUBAND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT 214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP 214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30 1.0. DRILLROTATE229' TO 285' (56') 56'IHR. 18/20K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTIONTESTDIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 285' TO 350' (65') 65'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICERIG.

18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588' (238') 47.6'lHR. 22/25K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @503', 3/4 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL ROTATE 588' TO 1005' (417') 69.5'lHR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIGON DAYWORK 10:00 AM, 8/12/04

NOTIF1EDUTAHDNR (CARROLDANIELS)OF INTENT TO SPUD @08:30 8/12/04

FUELATSTARTOF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETYMEETlNG: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNINGSLICK LINE SURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD7-7/8" HOLEAT3:30 PM, 8/12/04

08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUCRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17½ "HOLE@ 3:00 PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED 17 1/2"HOLETO 230'. RAN 5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#/FT,H-40, ST&CCASING& LANDED@
238.90' KB. RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. PRESSURETESTEDLINESAND CEMENT VALVE TU 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED20 BBLS GELLEDWATER& 20 BBLSWATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT. MIXED& PUMPED 225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENTW/2%CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT@15.8PPGW/YIELDOF l.15
CF/SX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT W/29 BBLSWATER & SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE.HAD 12 BBLS
CEMENT RETURNS TO SURFACE. RD BIG4. PREPAREDLOCATIONFOR RUTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP
FROMREPORTUNTIL FURTHERACTIVITY,

EDTROTTER NOTIFIEDCAROLDANIELSWlUOGM OF SPUDDINGWELL AT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 1,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRUTRUERIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER,HCRANDHOOKUP CHOKE LINES.

13:30 14:30 1.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHP51 BIT, 5/6 LOBE4 STAGE MOTOR,SHOCKSUBAND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT 214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP 214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30 1.0. DRILLROTATE229' TO 285' (56') 56'IHR. 18/20K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTIONTESTDIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 285' TO 350' (65') 65'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICERIG.

18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588' (238') 47.6'lHR. 22/25K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @503', 3/4 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL ROTATE 588' TO 1005' (417') 69.5'lHR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIGON DAYWORK 10:00 AM, 8/12/04

NOTIF1EDUTAHDNR (CARROLDANIELS)OF INTENT TO SPUD @08:30 8/12/04

FUELATSTARTOF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETYMEETlNG: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNINGSLICK LINE SURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD7-7/8" HOLEAT3:30 PM, 8/12/04

08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Page



Well Name: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL& ROTATE1005'TO 1117'(112') 74.6'lHR, 38/40K WOB, 155 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY @1048', 3/4 DEG.
08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE1117'TO 136S'(248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45KWOB, 127RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTEST DIVERTER.

11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE1365'TO 1610'(245') 61.2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM,

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540', 2 1/2 DEG.
15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL & ROTATE1610'TO 1927' (317') 48.7'lHR, 45/48KWOB, 130 RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @1843', 2 3/4 DEG.
22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1927' TO 2260' (333') 44.4'lHR, 45/48K WOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:REPAIR PUMP/WORKINGWITH NEW HANDS/WIRELINESURVEY
TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55%LS
BGG-72, CG-378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: SHORTTRIP PRIOR TO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & RUTATE 2260' TO 2370' (l 10') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @2300', 1 1/4DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE 2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.S'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTDIVERTER.

I I:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE245T TO 2865'(408') 45.3'/HR, 48/52KWOB, 45/82 RPM.

20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY@2780', 2 DEG.
20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE2865' TO 3200' (335') 44.6'/HR, 48/52KWOB, 45/82 RPM. STARTEDLOSINGWATER AT ±3000'

LOSTTOTAL OF 640 BBLS EST.

04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3ll3',l DEG.
04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORTTRIPTO DRILL COLLARS. HOLETAKING 2 TIMES NORMALFILL

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNINGFORK LIFT WIRELINE SURVEYS

TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION:GREEN RIVER 20%SH, 35%SS, 45% LS
BGG 34, CG 43

08-16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Page

Well Name: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL& ROTATE1005'TO 1117'(112') 74.6'lHR, 38/40K WOB, 155 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY @1048', 3/4 DEG.
08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE1117'TO 136S'(248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45KWOB, 127RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTEST DIVERTER.

11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE1365'TO 1610'(245') 61.2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM,

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540', 2 1/2 DEG.
15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL & ROTATE1610'TO 1927' (317') 48.7'lHR, 45/48KWOB, 130 RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @1843', 2 3/4 DEG.
22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1927' TO 2260' (333') 44.4'lHR, 45/48K WOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:REPAIR PUMP/WORKINGWITH NEW HANDS/WIRELINESURVEY
TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55%LS
BGG-72, CG-378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: SHORTTRIP PRIOR TO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & RUTATE 2260' TO 2370' (l 10') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @2300', 1 1/4DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE 2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.S'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTDIVERTER.

I I:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE245T TO 2865'(408') 45.3'/HR, 48/52KWOB, 45/82 RPM.

20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY@2780', 2 DEG.
20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE2865' TO 3200' (335') 44.6'/HR, 48/52KWOB, 45/82 RPM. STARTEDLOSINGWATER AT ±3000'

LOSTTOTAL OF 640 BBLS EST.

04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3ll3',l DEG.
04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORTTRIPTO DRILL COLLARS. HOLETAKING 2 TIMES NORMALFILL

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNINGFORK LIFT WIRELINE SURVEYS

TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION:GREEN RIVER 20%SH, 35%SS, 45% LS
BGG 34, CG 43

08-16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL& ROTATE1005'TO 1117'(112') 74.6'lHR, 38/40K WOB, 155 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY @1048', 3/4 DEG.
08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE1117'TO 136S'(248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45KWOB, 127RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTEST DIVERTER.

11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE1365'TO 1610'(245') 61.2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM,

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540', 2 1/2 DEG.
15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL & ROTATE1610'TO 1927' (317') 48.7'lHR, 45/48KWOB, 130 RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @1843', 2 3/4 DEG.
22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1927' TO 2260' (333') 44.4'lHR, 45/48K WOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:REPAIR PUMP/WORKINGWITH NEW HANDS/WIRELINESURVEY
TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55%LS
BGG-72, CG-378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: SHORTTRIP PRIOR TO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & RUTATE 2260' TO 2370' (l 10') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @2300', 1 1/4DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE 2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.S'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTDIVERTER.

I I:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE245T TO 2865'(408') 45.3'/HR, 48/52KWOB, 45/82 RPM.

20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY@2780', 2 DEG.
20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE2865' TO 3200' (335') 44.6'/HR, 48/52KWOB, 45/82 RPM. STARTEDLOSINGWATER AT ±3000'

LOSTTOTAL OF 640 BBLS EST.

04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3ll3',l DEG.
04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORTTRIPTO DRILL COLLARS. HOLETAKING 2 TIMES NORMALFILL

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNINGFORK LIFT WIRELINE SURVEYS

TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION:GREEN RIVER 20%SH, 35%SS, 45% LS
BGG 34, CG 43

08-16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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Well Name:STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 l.0 FINISHWIPERTRIPTO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE,NO FILL, NO DRAG.

07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATEDBOTTOMSUP,CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILL ADDITIONAL89' DUETO DRILLBREAKS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'lHR, 48/50K WOB,45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE. CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.

l2:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATE3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'/HR, 48/50KWOB,45/82RPM.
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED DIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'/HR, 48/50K WOB,45/82 RPM.

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATEBOTTOMSUP. SPOT75 BBLSLCM PILLON BOTTOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO RUNCASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWNMACHlNE. LAID DOWN 3 - 8" COLLARS, MOTOR AND SHOCKSUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELD PRE-JOB SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASING AS FOLLOWS: GUIDE SHOE, 1 FLOAT
JOINT, FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RAN TOTAL OF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASING SHOE
LANDED AT 3400', FLOAT COLLAR AT 3353', RAN CENTRALIZERS5'ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,
THEN EVERY 5THJT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOM OF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUG RETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCH TO SCHLUMBERGER, LEAD W/285 SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12% D20, l% D79, .25% Dll2, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXEDAT 11.0PPG,YIELD3.91.TAIL WITH320 SXS "G"W/10%DS3,2% $1, .25 PPS D29, MIXED AT
14.2 PPGYIELD 1.61. DROPPED PLUGAND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLS WATER, DID NOT BUMP PLUG,HAD
FULL RETURNSTHROUGHOUTJOBWITH 50 BBLSCEMENT TO SURFACE.RELEASEPSI, FLOATEQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER,SET SLIPSON 9 5/8" CSGWITH98K STRINGWT
04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUE ND DIVERTER AND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING:OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NOTIFIED UTAH DOG&M OF INTENT TO SET AND CEMENT INTERMEDIATE CASING(LEFT CAROL
DANIELSA MESSAGE)AT09:30AM, 8/15/04
RECIEVED 73 JTS 9 5/8" CASING FROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TUTAL PIPE ON LOCATION
3451'

FORMATION: GREENRIVER 35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Vise 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINAL CUT ON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOGWITHSCHLUMBERGERWHILENU BOP'S.
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Well Name:STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 l.0 FINISHWIPERTRIPTO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE,NO FILL, NO DRAG.

07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATEDBOTTOMSUP,CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILL ADDITIONAL89' DUETO DRILLBREAKS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'lHR, 48/50K WOB,45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE. CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.

l2:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATE3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'/HR, 48/50KWOB,45/82RPM.
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED DIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'/HR, 48/50K WOB,45/82 RPM.

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATEBOTTOMSUP. SPOT75 BBLSLCM PILLON BOTTOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO RUNCASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWNMACHlNE. LAID DOWN 3 - 8" COLLARS, MOTOR AND SHOCKSUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELD PRE-JOB SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASING AS FOLLOWS: GUIDE SHOE, 1 FLOAT
JOINT, FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RAN TOTAL OF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASING SHOE
LANDED AT 3400', FLOAT COLLAR AT 3353', RAN CENTRALIZERS5'ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,
THEN EVERY 5THJT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOM OF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUG RETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCH TO SCHLUMBERGER, LEAD W/285 SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12% D20, l% D79, .25% Dll2, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXEDAT 11.0PPG,YIELD3.91.TAIL WITH320 SXS "G"W/10%DS3,2% $1, .25 PPS D29, MIXED AT
14.2 PPGYIELD 1.61. DROPPED PLUGAND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLS WATER, DID NOT BUMP PLUG,HAD
FULL RETURNSTHROUGHOUTJOBWITH 50 BBLSCEMENT TO SURFACE.RELEASEPSI, FLOATEQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER,SET SLIPSON 9 5/8" CSGWITH98K STRINGWT
04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUE ND DIVERTER AND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING:OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NOTIFIED UTAH DOG&M OF INTENT TO SET AND CEMENT INTERMEDIATE CASING(LEFT CAROL
DANIELSA MESSAGE)AT09:30AM, 8/15/04
RECIEVED 73 JTS 9 5/8" CASING FROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TUTAL PIPE ON LOCATION
3451'

FORMATION: GREENRIVER 35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Vise 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINAL CUT ON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOGWITHSCHLUMBERGERWHILENU BOP'S.
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Well Name:STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 l.0 FINISHWIPERTRIPTO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE,NO FILL, NO DRAG.

07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATEDBOTTOMSUP,CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILL ADDITIONAL89' DUETO DRILLBREAKS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'lHR, 48/50K WOB,45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE. CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.

l2:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATE3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'/HR, 48/50KWOB,45/82RPM.
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED DIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'/HR, 48/50K WOB,45/82 RPM.

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATEBOTTOMSUP. SPOT75 BBLSLCM PILLON BOTTOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO RUNCASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWNMACHlNE. LAID DOWN 3 - 8" COLLARS, MOTOR AND SHOCKSUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELD PRE-JOB SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASING AS FOLLOWS: GUIDE SHOE, 1 FLOAT
JOINT, FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RAN TOTAL OF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASING SHOE
LANDED AT 3400', FLOAT COLLAR AT 3353', RAN CENTRALIZERS5'ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,
THEN EVERY 5THJT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOM OF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUG RETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCH TO SCHLUMBERGER, LEAD W/285 SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12% D20, l% D79, .25% Dll2, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXEDAT 11.0PPG,YIELD3.91.TAIL WITH320 SXS "G"W/10%DS3,2% $1, .25 PPS D29, MIXED AT
14.2 PPGYIELD 1.61. DROPPED PLUGAND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLS WATER, DID NOT BUMP PLUG,HAD
FULL RETURNSTHROUGHOUTJOBWITH 50 BBLSCEMENT TO SURFACE.RELEASEPSI, FLOATEQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER,SET SLIPSON 9 5/8" CSGWITH98K STRINGWT
04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUE ND DIVERTER AND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING:OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NOTIFIED UTAH DOG&M OF INTENT TO SET AND CEMENT INTERMEDIATE CASING(LEFT CAROL
DANIELSA MESSAGE)AT09:30AM, 8/15/04
RECIEVED 73 JTS 9 5/8" CASING FROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TUTAL PIPE ON LOCATION
3451'

FORMATION: GREENRIVER 35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Vise 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINAL CUT ON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOGWITHSCHLUMBERGERWHILENU BOP'S.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:0SSSl7

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTEDBLINDRAMS,PIPE RAMS,FLOOR VALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATEDVALVESTO 250& 5000 PSI.
TESTED HYDRIL 250 & 2500 PSI WITH B&CQUICK TEST,ALL TESTS 10MINUTES. TESTEDCASINGTO 1500
PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEAR BUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKE UP HYCALOGDSX210JETTED .85 TFA ONA HUNTING7/8 LOBE2.9 STAGE MOTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLEWITHSAMETO TOP OF CEMENT.

l9:00 20:30 1.5 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10' NEW HOLETO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FITTESTTO 12.3PPG EQUIVALENTWITH 8.4 PPGWATERIN HOLE AND 690 PSI. APPLIED PSI,
HELDFOR 15MIN, OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATEWlMOTOR3410' TO 3680'(270') 77.l'lHR, 18KWOB, 57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @3598', 1/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE3680' TO 4115' (435') 8T/HR, 18KWOB,57/46RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:CEMENTING/NUBOP/CUT DRILL LINE

TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION:GREENRIVER30% SH, 20% SS, 15%SLTST, 35% LS

BGG 34, CG 83, HG465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATEW/MOTOR4115' TO 4198'(83') 83'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 4198' TO 4668'(470') 94'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL& ROTATE4668' TO 5175' (507') 92.l'/HR, 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200--250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @5095', 1 1/2 DEG.

19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL & ROTATE 5175' TO 6040' (865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING: SLINGINGPIPE FROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROMV-DOOR/SLICKLINESURVEYS/BOP
DRILL 1MIN40 SEC

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH @4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15%SLTST,5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:0SSSl7

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTEDBLINDRAMS,PIPE RAMS,FLOOR VALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATEDVALVESTO 250& 5000 PSI.
TESTED HYDRIL 250 & 2500 PSI WITH B&CQUICK TEST,ALL TESTS 10MINUTES. TESTEDCASINGTO 1500
PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEAR BUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKE UP HYCALOGDSX210JETTED .85 TFA ONA HUNTING7/8 LOBE2.9 STAGE MOTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLEWITHSAMETO TOP OF CEMENT.

l9:00 20:30 1.5 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10' NEW HOLETO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FITTESTTO 12.3PPG EQUIVALENTWITH 8.4 PPGWATERIN HOLE AND 690 PSI. APPLIED PSI,
HELDFOR 15MIN, OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATEWlMOTOR3410' TO 3680'(270') 77.l'lHR, 18KWOB, 57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @3598', 1/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE3680' TO 4115' (435') 8T/HR, 18KWOB,57/46RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:CEMENTING/NUBOP/CUT DRILL LINE

TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION:GREENRIVER30% SH, 20% SS, 15%SLTST, 35% LS

BGG 34, CG 83, HG465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATEW/MOTOR4115' TO 4198'(83') 83'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 4198' TO 4668'(470') 94'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL& ROTATE4668' TO 5175' (507') 92.l'/HR, 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200--250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @5095', 1 1/2 DEG.

19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL & ROTATE 5175' TO 6040' (865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING: SLINGINGPIPE FROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROMV-DOOR/SLICKLINESURVEYS/BOP
DRILL 1MIN40 SEC

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH @4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15%SLTST,5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:0SSSl7

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTEDBLINDRAMS,PIPE RAMS,FLOOR VALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATEDVALVESTO 250& 5000 PSI.
TESTED HYDRIL 250 & 2500 PSI WITH B&CQUICK TEST,ALL TESTS 10MINUTES. TESTEDCASINGTO 1500
PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEAR BUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKE UP HYCALOGDSX210JETTED .85 TFA ONA HUNTING7/8 LOBE2.9 STAGE MOTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLEWITHSAMETO TOP OF CEMENT.

l9:00 20:30 1.5 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10' NEW HOLETO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FITTESTTO 12.3PPG EQUIVALENTWITH 8.4 PPGWATERIN HOLE AND 690 PSI. APPLIED PSI,
HELDFOR 15MIN, OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATEWlMOTOR3410' TO 3680'(270') 77.l'lHR, 18KWOB, 57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @3598', 1/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE3680' TO 4115' (435') 8T/HR, 18KWOB,57/46RPM.

SAFETYMEETING:CEMENTING/NUBOP/CUT DRILL LINE

TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION:GREENRIVER30% SH, 20% SS, 15%SLTST, 35% LS

BGG 34, CG 83, HG465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATEW/MOTOR4115' TO 4198'(83') 83'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 4198' TO 4668'(470') 94'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL& ROTATE4668' TO 5175' (507') 92.l'/HR, 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200--250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @5095', 1 1/2 DEG.

19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL & ROTATE 5175' TO 6040' (865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING: SLINGINGPIPE FROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROMV-DOOR/SLICKLINESURVEYS/BOP
DRILL 1MIN40 SEC

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH @4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15%SLTST,5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:0SSSt7

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE WlM(ITOR 6040' TO 6146' (106') 106'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF. BOP DRILL
I MIN, 40 SEC.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY@6064', 1 3/4 DEG.

07:30 l1:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE6146' TO 6451'(305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20K WOB,57/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF

1I:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRILL, FLOOR VALVES & CHECKED CROWN- MATIC. BOP DRILL
DAYSI MIN,50 SEC.

12:00 23:30 11.5 DRILLROTATE6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.l'/HR, 18/22KWOB,22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @7089', 2 DEG.

00;00 06:00 6.0 DRILL & ROTATE 7131' TO 7470'(339') 56.5'lHR, 18/22KWOB, 22/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF

SAFETY MEETING: CHANGINGOIL/LOADING AND UNLOADING/WORKINGIN RAIN

TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION:NORTHHORN@6300', 65% SH,20% SS, 15%SLTST

08-20-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL & ROTATE W/MOTOR7470' TO 7809' (339') 48.4'lHR, 18/22K WOB, 22/57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFE

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDPIPE RAMS,HYDRIL& CHECKEDCROWN-O-MATIC.

13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE 7809' TO 8384' (575') 34.8'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFE

STARTED LIGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETY MEETING:MIXINGCHEMICAL/WORKINGON PUMPS
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: DARK CANYON TOP @8280', 79% SH, 20% SS, 10% SLTST

08-21-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 3LO

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILLROTATE8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100DIFF.

08:00 12:00 4.0 SLUG,DROP SURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLEFORBIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAGON FIRST 5 STANDS,CLEAN
WITHNO DRAGAFTERTHAI SURVEY @8400'- 2 DEG.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICERIG.FUNCTIONTESTBLINDS,RAMS,CHOKE,FLOORVALVES.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:0SSSt7

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE WlM(ITOR 6040' TO 6146' (106') 106'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF. BOP DRILL
I MIN, 40 SEC.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY@6064', 1 3/4 DEG.

07:30 l1:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE6146' TO 6451'(305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20K WOB,57/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF

1I:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRILL, FLOOR VALVES & CHECKED CROWN- MATIC. BOP DRILL
DAYSI MIN,50 SEC.

12:00 23:30 11.5 DRILLROTATE6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.l'/HR, 18/22KWOB,22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @7089', 2 DEG.

00;00 06:00 6.0 DRILL & ROTATE 7131' TO 7470'(339') 56.5'lHR, 18/22KWOB, 22/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF

SAFETY MEETING: CHANGINGOIL/LOADING AND UNLOADING/WORKINGIN RAIN

TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION:NORTHHORN@6300', 65% SH,20% SS, 15%SLTST

08-20-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL & ROTATE W/MOTOR7470' TO 7809' (339') 48.4'lHR, 18/22K WOB, 22/57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFE

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDPIPE RAMS,HYDRIL& CHECKEDCROWN-O-MATIC.

13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE 7809' TO 8384' (575') 34.8'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFE

STARTED LIGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETY MEETING:MIXINGCHEMICAL/WORKINGON PUMPS
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: DARK CANYON TOP @8280', 79% SH, 20% SS, 10% SLTST

08-21-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 3LO

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILLROTATE8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100DIFF.

08:00 12:00 4.0 SLUG,DROP SURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLEFORBIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAGON FIRST 5 STANDS,CLEAN
WITHNO DRAGAFTERTHAI SURVEY @8400'- 2 DEG.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICERIG.FUNCTIONTESTBLINDS,RAMS,CHOKE,FLOORVALVES.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKEUP BIT #3 - HTCHCSO6ZJETTEDWITH0.66"TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT. ROLLER REAMERS (ONE AT 30' &
OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGE BUTTON CUTTERS ON EACH,TRIP IN HOLEWITH SAME.

16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30' OF FILLON BOTTOM. PATTERNBIT.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL 8429' TO 9090'(66l') 48.9'/HR. 28/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNINGWATERAROUNDELECTICALOUTLETS,TRIPPING,IMPORTANCEOF USING
STATICLINE.

WEATHER: 58 DEG.PARTLYCLOUDY, CALM

FORMATION:PRICE RIVER TOP @8549', 40%SH,50% SS, 10% SLTST.

BGG-30, CG-52, TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 1I:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') SS.6'lHR. 30KWOB,58 RPM.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY @9326' - 2 1/4DEG.
12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL 9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. RAISE WT. TO 9.5 PPGAT9400'

17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICERIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL,FLOOR VALVES.

17:30 l8:00 0.5 CHANGEOUT ROTATINGHEADINSERTAND FLOWSENSOR.

18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL 9675' TO 10195' (520') 43.3'IHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10PPG PRIOR TO THE
BLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.

WEATHER 53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST,20% CARB SH.
BGG3747, CG 1306,HIGHGAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 MW 10.5 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICERIG, FUNCTIONTEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227' TO 10250' (23') 5.1'lHR. 14/30KWOB.58 RPM.
12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROP SURVEY,PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #4. BIT WORN FLAT ON SHOULDERTO MATRIX. INNER

CUTTERSIN GOODSHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTIONTESTBLINDRAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX146HGJW AND TRIP IN HOLETO CASINGSHOE.

20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP& CUT DRILLLINE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKEUP BIT #3 - HTCHCSO6ZJETTEDWITH0.66"TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT. ROLLER REAMERS (ONE AT 30' &
OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGE BUTTON CUTTERS ON EACH,TRIP IN HOLEWITH SAME.

16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30' OF FILLON BOTTOM. PATTERNBIT.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL 8429' TO 9090'(66l') 48.9'/HR. 28/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNINGWATERAROUNDELECTICALOUTLETS,TRIPPING,IMPORTANCEOF USING
STATICLINE.

WEATHER: 58 DEG.PARTLYCLOUDY, CALM

FORMATION:PRICE RIVER TOP @8549', 40%SH,50% SS, 10% SLTST.

BGG-30, CG-52, TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 1I:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') SS.6'lHR. 30KWOB,58 RPM.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY @9326' - 2 1/4DEG.
12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL 9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. RAISE WT. TO 9.5 PPGAT9400'

17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICERIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL,FLOOR VALVES.

17:30 l8:00 0.5 CHANGEOUT ROTATINGHEADINSERTAND FLOWSENSOR.

18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL 9675' TO 10195' (520') 43.3'IHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10PPG PRIOR TO THE
BLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.

WEATHER 53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST,20% CARB SH.
BGG3747, CG 1306,HIGHGAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 MW 10.5 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICERIG, FUNCTIONTEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227' TO 10250' (23') 5.1'lHR. 14/30KWOB.58 RPM.
12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROP SURVEY,PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #4. BIT WORN FLAT ON SHOULDERTO MATRIX. INNER

CUTTERSIN GOODSHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTIONTESTBLINDRAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX146HGJW AND TRIP IN HOLETO CASINGSHOE.

20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP& CUT DRILLLINE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKEUP BIT #3 - HTCHCSO6ZJETTEDWITH0.66"TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT. ROLLER REAMERS (ONE AT 30' &
OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGE BUTTON CUTTERS ON EACH,TRIP IN HOLEWITH SAME.

16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30' OF FILLON BOTTOM. PATTERNBIT.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL 8429' TO 9090'(66l') 48.9'/HR. 28/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNINGWATERAROUNDELECTICALOUTLETS,TRIPPING,IMPORTANCEOF USING
STATICLINE.

WEATHER: 58 DEG.PARTLYCLOUDY, CALM

FORMATION:PRICE RIVER TOP @8549', 40%SH,50% SS, 10% SLTST.

BGG-30, CG-52, TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 1I:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') SS.6'lHR. 30KWOB,58 RPM.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY @9326' - 2 1/4DEG.
12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL 9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. RAISE WT. TO 9.5 PPGAT9400'

17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICERIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL,FLOOR VALVES.

17:30 l8:00 0.5 CHANGEOUT ROTATINGHEADINSERTAND FLOWSENSOR.

18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL 9675' TO 10195' (520') 43.3'IHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10PPG PRIOR TO THE
BLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.

WEATHER 53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST,20% CARB SH.
BGG3747, CG 1306,HIGHGAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 MW 10.5 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICERIG, FUNCTIONTEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227' TO 10250' (23') 5.1'lHR. 14/30KWOB.58 RPM.
12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROP SURVEY,PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #4. BIT WORN FLAT ON SHOULDERTO MATRIX. INNER

CUTTERSIN GOODSHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTIONTESTBLINDRAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX146HGJW AND TRIP IN HOLETO CASINGSHOE.

20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP& CUT DRILLLINE.
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WellName:STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISH IN HOLEFILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.

01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM7l' TO BOTTOMSLOWLY. TORQUEYLAST20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290'(40') 10'lHR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:CHAINS,HOSES,ETC.AROUND ROTARY TABLE,TRIPPINGAND CUTTING DRILL LINE.

WEATHER:57 DEG,FAIR,WIND WEST @5 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP@9931', 50%SH, 35% SS, 5% SLTST,10% CARBSH.

BGG2353,CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280, HIGH GAS $534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304' (14') 9.3'/HR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGEDSWAB & SEAT IN PUMPS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304'TO 10,350'(46') 13.l'/HR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRIL & FLOOR VALVES.

l2:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350' TO 10,708'(358') 19.8'/HR, 16/18K WOB,55 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKINGON PUMPS
TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWERPRICE RIVER @10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, S%SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL

BGG 2454, CG 4672,HIGHGAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES>l'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708' TO 10,846'(138') 27.6'/HR, ISKWOB, 55 RPM.

I1:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS,HYDRILAND HCR.

l l:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846' TO 11,046'(200') 10.8'lHR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG

TEMP50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP @10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, 10% COAL

BGG 2799, CG 5849,HIGHGAS4269
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WellName:STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISH IN HOLEFILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.

01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM7l' TO BOTTOMSLOWLY. TORQUEYLAST20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290'(40') 10'lHR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:CHAINS,HOSES,ETC.AROUND ROTARY TABLE,TRIPPINGAND CUTTING DRILL LINE.

WEATHER:57 DEG,FAIR,WIND WEST @5 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP@9931', 50%SH, 35% SS, 5% SLTST,10% CARBSH.

BGG2353,CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280, HIGH GAS $534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304' (14') 9.3'/HR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGEDSWAB & SEAT IN PUMPS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304'TO 10,350'(46') 13.l'/HR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRIL & FLOOR VALVES.

l2:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350' TO 10,708'(358') 19.8'/HR, 16/18K WOB,55 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWERPRICE RIVER @10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, S%SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL

BGG 2454, CG 4672,HIGHGAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES>l'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708' TO 10,846'(138') 27.6'/HR, ISKWOB, 55 RPM.

I1:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS,HYDRILAND HCR.

l l:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846' TO 11,046'(200') 10.8'lHR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG

TEMP50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP @10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, 10% COAL

BGG 2799, CG 5849,HIGHGAS4269
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WellName:STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISH IN HOLEFILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.

01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM7l' TO BOTTOMSLOWLY. TORQUEYLAST20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290'(40') 10'lHR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:CHAINS,HOSES,ETC.AROUND ROTARY TABLE,TRIPPINGAND CUTTING DRILL LINE.

WEATHER:57 DEG,FAIR,WIND WEST @5 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP@9931', 50%SH, 35% SS, 5% SLTST,10% CARBSH.

BGG2353,CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280, HIGH GAS $534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304' (14') 9.3'/HR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGEDSWAB & SEAT IN PUMPS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304'TO 10,350'(46') 13.l'/HR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRIL & FLOOR VALVES.

l2:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350' TO 10,708'(358') 19.8'/HR, 16/18K WOB,55 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWERPRICE RIVER @10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, S%SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL

BGG 2454, CG 4672,HIGHGAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES>l'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708' TO 10,846'(138') 27.6'/HR, ISKWOB, 55 RPM.

I1:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS,HYDRILAND HCR.

l l:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846' TO 11,046'(200') 10.8'lHR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG

TEMP50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP @10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, 10% COAL

BGG 2799, CG 5849,HIGHGAS4269
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIGSPRING Property:055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLOR/CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion We11Total

MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Visc 45.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL 11,046' TO I1,146'(100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB, 57 RPM.

17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPED SLUG. DROPPED SURVEY. TOH FOR BIT #5, NO TIGHT SPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE,INNERSTRUCTURE
GOOD, WORNCUTTERS AND FLATTENED CUTTERSON OUTSIDE.

23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKEUP BIT #5, HTC HC506ZANDTIH. WASHED& REAMED LAST 20' WITHOUT MUCHTORQUE.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL l1,l46' TO 11,160'(14') 14FPH,WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION:BLACKHAWKTOP@11,112', 35%SH, 50%SS, S% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, COAL < 5%

BGG 2200,TRIP GAS 6000

08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW 11.1 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160'TO 11,650' (490') 20 FPH,WOB ISK,56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION:SUNNYSIDETOP@11,370', 20%SH, 65% SS, 10% SLTST, 5% CARB SH

BG GAS 3284U,CONNGAS 5154U

08-28-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW 11.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNOPENHOLELOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL 11650'-- 11700' TD. REACHEDTD @09:30,8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH, WOB 19K, 56 RPM, PP 1550.

09:30 11:00 1.5 CIRCULATED FOR SHORT TRIP.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SHORTTRIP 15STANDS,NO DRAGOR FILL.

12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATEDTRIP GAS OUT, 6900 UNITS. PUMPEDPILL.

14:00 19:00 5.0 TOHFOR LOGS. SCHLUMBERGER ON LOCATION @17:00.
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIGSPRING Property:055517
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WellName:STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETY MEETING. RU SCHLUMBERGER.LOGGINGWELL. LOGSRUN:PLATFORMEXPRESSWITH
DIPOLESONICFROM TD TO BASEOF INT CASING. ROTARY SIDEWALL CORES IN NEXT RUNS.

SAFETY MEETING: LOGGING

08-29-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW I1.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FISHINGROTARYCORINGTOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGWISCHLUMBERGER. FINISHEDRUNNINGPLATFORMEXPRESS& DIPOLE SONIC,LOGGERS TD

WAS11,706'.
07:00 09:00 2.0 WAIT ON ORDERS (CORE POINTSOFF OF LOGS). RECEIVEDCOREPOINTSFROM GEOLOGYDEPT.

09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARYSIDEWALLCORETOOL, MADE ONE CORE @11,653'AND WAS STUCK.

12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKED TOOL, TRIED TO GET FREEWITHNO PROGRESSWHILEWAITlNGON WEATHERFORD
FISHERMAN& TOOLS.

17:00 20:00 3.0 RU WEATHERFORD TO STRIP OVER WIRELINE AND FISH TOOL. SAFETY MEETING:DON'T GET IN A
HURRY.

20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPINGOVER WIRELINE,CAME LOOSE@4185'.
01:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINETOGETHER AND PULLED TOOL INTOOVERSHOT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 PULLED LINE OUT OF TOOL AND POH W/ELECTRICCABLE.

SAFETY MEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTED CAROL DANIELSW/UOGMAT 10:30 AM, 8/26/04TONOTIFY OF PRODUCTION CASING
CEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTED DAN JARVIS(LEFT MESSAGE, NOAFTER-HOURS NUMBER) W/UTAH
DNR AT 11:30 AM, 8-27-04 W/NOTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT, SLURRY & UPDATED TIMING
FOR PRODUCTION CEMENT JOB.

08-30-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 1LO VIsc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 TOH W/DP, FISHINGTOOLS& CORE TOOL (FISH). LD FISH.

09:00 10:00 f .0 BREAK DOWN FISHING TOOLS, REMOVEDWEARBUSHING.
10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH W/TRI-CONE BIT TO CLEANOUTAND CONDITIONE HOLE FOR CASING,4' FILL.

15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATED ANDCONDITIONED HOLE FOR CASING.
17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETYMEETING. RIGUP WESTATES CASINGSERVICE. LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE.
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Wel1Name: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

02:00 06:00 4.0 RUWESTATESCASINGTOOLS. SAFETY MEETING. RUN 4 1/2", 11.6#,P-110, LTCCASING AS FOLLOWS:
FLOATSHOE, 1 JT CASING,FLOATCOLLAR, CASING. CENTRALIZERSON MIDDLEFIRSTJOINT,EVERY
OTHER JOINT TO 8800' (37 TOTAL). MARKERJOINTS@901l' AND 6336'. (4100'OF CASINGPICKEDUP @
REPORT TIME).

SAFETY MEETING:LD DRILLPIPE

08-31-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD I1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETlON

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 FINISHED RUNNINGTOTALOF 293 JOINTS(291 FULL JTS + 2 - 20' MARKERJOINTS)OF 4 1/2", 11.6#, HC P-
110, LTC CASING. SHOE DEPTH I1,695', FLOAT COLLAR I1,652', 20' MARKER JTS 8989-9009' & 6334-6354'.
NO TIGHT SPOTSOR FILL. STRINGWEIGHT112,000#BEFORE CEMENTING.

09:00 11:00 2.0 CIRCULATEDFOR CEMENT.

11:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL TO CEMENT. SAFETYMEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINESTO 5,000 PSI.
PUMPJOB AS FOLLOWS: 20 BBLS MUD FLUSH, 20 BBLS H2OAHEAD,LEAD SLURRY: 713 SX (2182 CU/FT) G
HI LIFT, 3.05 YLD, 11.5 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H2O, + 12% DO20+1% DO79 + .2% D167 + .2% DO46 + 2% D013 + .

25#/SKD029. TAIL SLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, l.29 YLD, 14.1PPG, 5.96 GAL/SK H2O, + 2%
D020 + .1% D046 + .1% D013 + .2% D167 + .2% DO65.DROPPEDPLUGAND DISPLACED W/l85.8 BBL H2O.
MAX PRESSURE2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUGTO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK .2 BBL,FLOATSHELD. RD
SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL. PU BOP AND SET SLIPS W/80,000 LBS(NO BLOCK WEIGHT). EST TOP OF
CEMENT 4,000'.

15:00 18:00 3.0 CLEANEDMUDTANKS.

18:00 06:00 12,0 RDMO. MOVING RIG TO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20. WILL DROPFROMREPORT UNTIL COMPLETION
COMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @ l8:00 HRS, 8/30/04.
CASINGPOINT COST

DIESELTRANSFERRED TO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS@$1.40/GAL.

09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRACBLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10M BOPE. RU CUTTERS WL. RaN CBL/VDL/GR/CCL FROMPBTDTO 8000' & ACROSS CEMENT TOP @
3550'. RDWL. PRESSURETESTEDCASING,BOPE& FLOW EQUIPMENT TO 8500 PSIG FOR 15MIN. SDFN.

09-04-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $115,879 Daily Total $115,879

Cum Costs: Drilling 5938,334 Completion $289,298 Well Total 51,227,633
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11:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL TO CEMENT. SAFETYMEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINESTO 5,000 PSI.
PUMPJOB AS FOLLOWS: 20 BBLS MUD FLUSH, 20 BBLS H2OAHEAD,LEAD SLURRY: 713 SX (2182 CU/FT) G
HI LIFT, 3.05 YLD, 11.5 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H2O, + 12% DO20+1% DO79 + .2% D167 + .2% DO46 + 2% D013 + .

25#/SKD029. TAIL SLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, l.29 YLD, 14.1PPG, 5.96 GAL/SK H2O, + 2%
D020 + .1% D046 + .1% D013 + .2% D167 + .2% DO65.DROPPEDPLUGAND DISPLACED W/l85.8 BBL H2O.
MAX PRESSURE2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUGTO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK .2 BBL,FLOATSHELD. RD
SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL. PU BOP AND SET SLIPS W/80,000 LBS(NO BLOCK WEIGHT). EST TOP OF
CEMENT 4,000'.

15:00 18:00 3.0 CLEANEDMUDTANKS.

18:00 06:00 12,0 RDMO. MOVING RIG TO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20. WILL DROPFROMREPORT UNTIL COMPLETION
COMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @ l8:00 HRS, 8/30/04.
CASINGPOINT COST

DIESELTRANSFERRED TO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS@$1.40/GAL.

09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRACBLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10M BOPE. RU CUTTERS WL. RaN CBL/VDL/GR/CCL FROMPBTDTO 8000' & ACROSS CEMENT TOP @
3550'. RDWL. PRESSURETESTEDCASING,BOPE& FLOW EQUIPMENT TO 8500 PSIG FOR 15MIN. SDFN.

09-04-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $115,879 Daily Total $115,879

Cum Costs: Drilling 5938,334 Completion $289,298 Well Total 51,227,633
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Wel1Name:STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Propeny: 055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATED SUNNYSIDEFROM 11391'-93', 11406'--09', 11433'-34', 11462'--63', l1485'-87'
& 11503'-05' Wl3-l/8" HSC PORTED CASINGGUNS@2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL.

RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRACDOWNCASINGW/4959 GALYFI25ST PAD,45,381 GAL YFl25ST & YF118ST &
168,556# 20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8348 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP6671 PSIG. ATR 46.2 BPM. ISIP4200
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10KCOMPOSITE FRACPLUG@l1323'. PERFORATED BLACKHAWKFROM 11122'-25', I1153-

55', 11229'-30', ll249'-50', 11274'-76' & 11289'-91'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRAC DOWN CASlNGW/4973 GAL YF125ST PAD, 58580 GAL YF125ST & YF118ST & 243,775#20/40 SAND @1-

6 PPG. MTP 8381PSIG. MTR 49.7 BPM. ATP 5671 PSIG. ATR 42.8 BPM. ISIP 5600 P$lG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 16 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIG. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED 1110 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.

09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200 PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED 920 BLW. 1220BLWTR.

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARINGBETWEEN FLUID SLUGS. MINIMAL
CONDENSATE. RECOVERED 790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRSON 24/64 CHOKE. FCP 150 PSIG. EST 10-12 BPH. RECOVERED 265 BLW. 525 BLWTR, FLUID
COMMING IN SLUGSNOT CONSTANTFLOW.

09-08-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $13,360 Daily Total $13,360
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Wel1Name:STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Propeny: 055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATED SUNNYSIDEFROM 11391'-93', 11406'--09', 11433'-34', 11462'--63', l1485'-87'
& 11503'-05' Wl3-l/8" HSC PORTED CASINGGUNS@2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL.

RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRACDOWNCASINGW/4959 GALYFI25ST PAD,45,381 GAL YFl25ST & YF118ST &
168,556# 20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8348 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP6671 PSIG. ATR 46.2 BPM. ISIP4200
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10KCOMPOSITE FRACPLUG@l1323'. PERFORATED BLACKHAWKFROM 11122'-25', I1153-

55', 11229'-30', ll249'-50', 11274'-76' & 11289'-91'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRAC DOWN CASlNGW/4973 GAL YF125ST PAD, 58580 GAL YF125ST & YF118ST & 243,775#20/40 SAND @1-

6 PPG. MTP 8381PSIG. MTR 49.7 BPM. ATP 5671 PSIG. ATR 42.8 BPM. ISIP 5600 P$lG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 16 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIG. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED 1110 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.

09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200 PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED 920 BLW. 1220BLWTR.

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARINGBETWEEN FLUID SLUGS. MINIMAL
CONDENSATE. RECOVERED 790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRSON 24/64 CHOKE. FCP 150 PSIG. EST 10-12 BPH. RECOVERED 265 BLW. 525 BLWTR, FLUID
COMMING IN SLUGSNOT CONSTANTFLOW.

09-08-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $13,360 Daily Total $13,360
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Wel1Name:STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Propeny: 055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATED SUNNYSIDEFROM 11391'-93', 11406'--09', 11433'-34', 11462'--63', l1485'-87'
& 11503'-05' Wl3-l/8" HSC PORTED CASINGGUNS@2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL.

RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRACDOWNCASINGW/4959 GALYFI25ST PAD,45,381 GAL YFl25ST & YF118ST &
168,556# 20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8348 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP6671 PSIG. ATR 46.2 BPM. ISIP4200
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10KCOMPOSITE FRACPLUG@l1323'. PERFORATED BLACKHAWKFROM 11122'-25', I1153-

55', 11229'-30', ll249'-50', 11274'-76' & 11289'-91'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRAC DOWN CASlNGW/4973 GAL YF125ST PAD, 58580 GAL YF125ST & YF118ST & 243,775#20/40 SAND @1-

6 PPG. MTP 8381PSIG. MTR 49.7 BPM. ATP 5671 PSIG. ATR 42.8 BPM. ISIP 5600 P$lG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 16 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIG. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED 1110 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.

09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200 PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED 920 BLW. 1220BLWTR.

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARINGBETWEEN FLUID SLUGS. MINIMAL
CONDENSATE. RECOVERED 790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRSON 24/64 CHOKE. FCP 150 PSIG. EST 10-12 BPH. RECOVERED 265 BLW. 525 BLWTR, FLUID
COMMING IN SLUGSNOT CONSTANTFLOW.

09-08-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $13,360 Daily Total $13,360
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTIONTUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRSON 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED252 BLW. 273 BLWTR.

MIRU DUCORIG#3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE& BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANEDOUT & DRILLED OUT PLUG @ l1,323'. RIH. FILL
@l1,469'. CLEANED OUT TO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD i1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POHW/TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP0 PSIG. SICP 0 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS& WELLSTARTEDFLOWING.
RECOVERED 44 BLW. FLOWED4 HRS. ON 32/64" CHOKE& LOGGED OFF. MADE 14 SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTED FLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW. FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPENCHOKE & LOGGED OFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELLOPENON 16/64"CHOKEOVERNIGHT. 115 BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MOVEIN FRACFLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FTP 0 PSIG, CP 1750 PSIG. CIRCULATEDWELLW/TREATEDWATER. POH. RU
COMPUTALOGWL SET CIBP @11,100',

PERFORATED CASTLEGATEFROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32' & 11,065-66' W/3-
1/8" HSC PORTEDCASINGGUNS@2 SPF & 180°PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTIONTUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRSON 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED252 BLW. 273 BLWTR.

MIRU DUCORIG#3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE& BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANEDOUT & DRILLED OUT PLUG @ l1,323'. RIH. FILL

@l1,469'. CLEANED OUT TO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD i1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POHW/TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP0 PSIG. SICP 0 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS& WELLSTARTEDFLOWING.
RECOVERED 44 BLW. FLOWED4 HRS. ON 32/64" CHOKE& LOGGED OFF. MADE 14 SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTED FLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW. FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPENCHOKE & LOGGED OFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELLOPENON 16/64"CHOKEOVERNIGHT. 115 BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MOVEIN FRACFLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FTP 0 PSIG, CP 1750 PSIG. CIRCULATEDWELLW/TREATEDWATER. POH. RU
COMPUTALOGWL SET CIBP @11,100',

PERFORATED CASTLEGATEFROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32' & 11,065-66' W/3-
1/8" HSC PORTEDCASINGGUNS@2 SPF & 180°PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTIONTUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRSON 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED252 BLW. 273 BLWTR.

MIRU DUCORIG#3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE& BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANEDOUT & DRILLED OUT PLUG @ l1,323'. RIH. FILL

@l1,469'. CLEANED OUT TO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD i1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POHW/TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP0 PSIG. SICP 0 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS& WELLSTARTEDFLOWING.
RECOVERED 44 BLW. FLOWED4 HRS. ON 32/64" CHOKE& LOGGED OFF. MADE 14 SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTED FLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW. FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPENCHOKE & LOGGED OFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELLOPENON 16/64"CHOKEOVERNIGHT. 115 BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MOVEIN FRACFLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FTP 0 PSIG, CP 1750 PSIG. CIRCULATEDWELLW/TREATEDWATER. POH. RU
COMPUTALOGWL SET CIBP @11,100',

PERFORATED CASTLEGATEFROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32' & 11,065-66' W/3-
1/8" HSC PORTEDCASINGGUNS@2 SPF & 180°PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Propeny:055517

MD 11,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERPARE FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PREP TO FRAC.

09-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion . Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10635-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLUE CASTLE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRAC CASTLEGATE DOWN CASINGW/5000GALYF125ST PAD, 53,760 GALS YF125ST

&YF118ST& 212,500#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. SCREENED OUT Wl40 BBLSFLUSHREMAINING. 206,300#
SAND IN FORMATION.MTP 8588PSIG. MTR50.9 BPM. ATP 6933 PSIG. ATR 44.2 BPM. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
FLOWED3.5 HRS THROUGH 10/64" & 24/64" CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR.
SLIGHTSAND.

RUWL. PERFORATED NELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52' @
2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SET COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG @10,882'. RDWL. RUSCHLUMBERGERPUMPS.
FRACED DOWN CASING W/5000 GALSYF125ST PAD, 49,518 GALSYFl25ST& YF118ST& 193,000#20/40
SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8555 PSIG. MTR 47.2 BPM. ATP 7546 PSIG. ATR 37 BPM. ISIP 4625 PSIG. SDFN.

09-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3700 PSIG. RUWL. SET WEATHERFORD COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG @10,359'. PERFED BLUE CASTLE

FROM 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14' & 10,323--25'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALSYFl2ST PAD, 38,430 GALSYFl25ST & YF118ST
& 139,100#20/40SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 7712 PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP6218 PSIG. ATR43 BPM. ISIP 4370
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG@10,225'. UNABLE TO GET OFF PLUG. PULLED OUT OF ROPE
SOCKET. RDWL. (FISHCONSISTSOF 1-7/16" CABLE HEAD, 3-1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR,3-1/8" QUICK
CHANGE, 19'X 3-1/8" CASINGGUN,SETTINGTOOLADAPTER, FIRING HEAD, SETTING TOOL& SETTING
SLEEVE. OVER ALL LENGTH32.5'). RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 14.25 HRSON 10/64"TO 24/64"CHOKE. AT 5 AM, 24/64" CHOKE,FCP400 PSIG, 55-60 BFPH.
RECOVERED 903 BLW. 2996 BLWTR.

09-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion . Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Propeny:055517

MD 11,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERPARE FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PREP TO FRAC.

09-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion . Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10635-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLUE CASTLE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRAC CASTLEGATE DOWN CASINGW/5000GALYF125ST PAD, 53,760 GALS YF125ST

&YF118ST& 212,500#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. SCREENED OUT Wl40 BBLSFLUSHREMAINING. 206,300#
SAND IN FORMATION.MTP 8588PSIG. MTR50.9 BPM. ATP 6933 PSIG. ATR 44.2 BPM. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
FLOWED3.5 HRS THROUGH 10/64" & 24/64" CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR.
SLIGHTSAND.

RUWL. PERFORATED NELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52' @
2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SET COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG @10,882'. RDWL. RUSCHLUMBERGERPUMPS.
FRACED DOWN CASING W/5000 GALSYF125ST PAD, 49,518 GALSYFl25ST& YF118ST& 193,000#20/40
SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8555 PSIG. MTR 47.2 BPM. ATP 7546 PSIG. ATR 37 BPM. ISIP 4625 PSIG. SDFN.

09-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3700 PSIG. RUWL. SET WEATHERFORD COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG @10,359'. PERFED BLUE CASTLE

FROM 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14' & 10,323--25'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALSYFl2ST PAD, 38,430 GALSYFl25ST & YF118ST
& 139,100#20/40SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 7712 PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP6218 PSIG. ATR43 BPM. ISIP 4370
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG@10,225'. UNABLE TO GET OFF PLUG. PULLED OUT OF ROPE
SOCKET. RDWL. (FISHCONSISTSOF 1-7/16" CABLE HEAD, 3-1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR,3-1/8" QUICK
CHANGE, 19'X 3-1/8" CASINGGUN,SETTINGTOOLADAPTER, FIRING HEAD, SETTING TOOL& SETTING
SLEEVE. OVER ALL LENGTH32.5'). RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 14.25 HRSON 10/64"TO 24/64"CHOKE. AT 5 AM, 24/64" CHOKE,FCP400 PSIG, 55-60 BFPH.
RECOVERED 903 BLW. 2996 BLWTR.

09-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion . Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Propeny:055517

MD 11,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERPARE FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PREP TO FRAC.

09-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion . Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10635-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLUE CASTLE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRAC CASTLEGATE DOWN CASINGW/5000GALYF125ST PAD, 53,760 GALS YF125ST

&YF118ST& 212,500#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. SCREENED OUT Wl40 BBLSFLUSHREMAINING. 206,300#
SAND IN FORMATION.MTP 8588PSIG. MTR50.9 BPM. ATP 6933 PSIG. ATR 44.2 BPM. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
FLOWED3.5 HRS THROUGH 10/64" & 24/64" CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR.
SLIGHTSAND.

RUWL. PERFORATED NELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52' @
2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SET COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG @10,882'. RDWL. RUSCHLUMBERGERPUMPS.
FRACED DOWN CASING W/5000 GALSYF125ST PAD, 49,518 GALSYFl25ST& YF118ST& 193,000#20/40
SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8555 PSIG. MTR 47.2 BPM. ATP 7546 PSIG. ATR 37 BPM. ISIP 4625 PSIG. SDFN.

09-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3700 PSIG. RUWL. SET WEATHERFORD COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG @10,359'. PERFED BLUE CASTLE

FROM 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14' & 10,323--25'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALSYFl2ST PAD, 38,430 GALSYFl25ST & YF118ST
& 139,100#20/40SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 7712 PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP6218 PSIG. ATR43 BPM. ISIP 4370
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG@10,225'. UNABLE TO GET OFF PLUG. PULLED OUT OF ROPE
SOCKET. RDWL. (FISHCONSISTSOF 1-7/16" CABLE HEAD, 3-1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR,3-1/8" QUICK
CHANGE, 19'X 3-1/8" CASINGGUN,SETTINGTOOLADAPTER, FIRING HEAD, SETTING TOOL& SETTING
SLEEVE. OVER ALL LENGTH32.5'). RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 14.25 HRSON 10/64"TO 24/64"CHOKE. AT 5 AM, 24/64" CHOKE,FCP400 PSIG, 55-60 BFPH.
RECOVERED 903 BLW. 2996 BLWTR.

09-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion . Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Page



WellName:STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLFRACPLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED4 HRSON 32/64" CHOKE. FCP 100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 48 BLW. 2948 BLWTR. KILLED
WELL Wl75 BBLSTREATED WATER. RIH W/OVERSHOT,JARS& BUMPER SUBTO 10,210'. CIRCULATED TO
TOP OF FISH @10,225'. LATCHED ONTO FISH. WORKEDFISHFREE. POH. LAYEDDOWN FISH & FISHING
TOOLS. RIH W/3--7/8"BIT & PUMPOFF SUBTO 9985'. SDFN.

09-17-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 33 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf: 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERF UPPER BLUE CASTLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 1900PSIG. SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. KILLED TUBINGWl25 BBLS TREATEDWATER.RIH
TO BP @10,225'. POHTO 9993'. DISPLACED HOLE W/TREATED WATER. PRESSURETESTED BP TO 4000
PSIG. POH. SDFN.

09-18-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion .
Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

09:00 12:30 3.5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RUCUTTERSWL. PERFORATED BLUE CASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',
10,178-80', 10185--88'& 10,193-95'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL SI. WO FRAC.

09-21-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SL WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURINGRIG UP SCHLUMBERGERHAD EQUIPMENT FAILURE. SI. WO FRAC EQUIPMENT

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP2400 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACBLUE CASTLE DOWNCASINGW/4946GALSYF125STPAD,
40,903 GALSYF125ST& YF118ST & 145,800# 20/40 SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6184 PSIG. ATR 42.4 BPM. ISIP 3875 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER. LEFT FRACHEAD ON BOPs. BLIND RAMS
WOULD NOT FULLYCLOSE.
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WellName:STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLFRACPLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED4 HRSON 32/64" CHOKE. FCP 100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 48 BLW. 2948 BLWTR. KILLED
WELL Wl75 BBLSTREATED WATER. RIH W/OVERSHOT,JARS& BUMPER SUBTO 10,210'. CIRCULATED TO
TOP OF FISH @10,225'. LATCHED ONTO FISH. WORKEDFISHFREE. POH. LAYEDDOWN FISH & FISHING
TOOLS. RIH W/3--7/8"BIT & PUMPOFF SUBTO 9985'. SDFN.

09-17-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 33 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf: 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERF UPPER BLUE CASTLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 1900PSIG. SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. KILLED TUBINGWl25 BBLS TREATEDWATER.RIH

TO BP @10,225'. POHTO 9993'. DISPLACED HOLE W/TREATED WATER. PRESSURETESTED BP TO 4000
PSIG. POH. SDFN.

09-18-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion .
Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

09:00 12:30 3.5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RUCUTTERSWL. PERFORATED BLUE CASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',
10,178-80', 10185--88'& 10,193-95'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL SI. WO FRAC.

09-21-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SL WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURINGRIG UP SCHLUMBERGERHAD EQUIPMENT FAILURE. SI. WO FRAC EQUIPMENT

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP2400 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACBLUE CASTLE DOWNCASINGW/4946GALSYF125STPAD,
40,903 GALSYF125ST& YF118ST & 145,800# 20/40 SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6184 PSIG. ATR 42.4 BPM. ISIP 3875 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER. LEFT FRACHEAD ON BOPs. BLIND RAMS
WOULD NOT FULLYCLOSE.

Page

WellName:STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLFRACPLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED4 HRSON 32/64" CHOKE. FCP 100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 48 BLW. 2948 BLWTR. KILLED
WELL Wl75 BBLSTREATED WATER. RIH W/OVERSHOT,JARS& BUMPER SUBTO 10,210'. CIRCULATED TO
TOP OF FISH @10,225'. LATCHED ONTO FISH. WORKEDFISHFREE. POH. LAYEDDOWN FISH & FISHING
TOOLS. RIH W/3--7/8"BIT & PUMPOFF SUBTO 9985'. SDFN.

09-17-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 33 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf: 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERF UPPER BLUE CASTLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 1900PSIG. SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. KILLED TUBINGWl25 BBLS TREATEDWATER.RIH

TO BP @10,225'. POHTO 9993'. DISPLACED HOLE W/TREATED WATER. PRESSURETESTED BP TO 4000
PSIG. POH. SDFN.

09-18-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion .
Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

09:00 12:30 3.5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RUCUTTERSWL. PERFORATED BLUE CASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',
10,178-80', 10185--88'& 10,193-95'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL SI. WO FRAC.

09-21-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SL WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURINGRIG UP SCHLUMBERGERHAD EQUIPMENT FAILURE. SI. WO FRAC EQUIPMENT

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP2400 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACBLUE CASTLE DOWNCASINGW/4946GALSYF125STPAD,
40,903 GALSYF125ST& YF118ST & 145,800# 20/40 SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6184 PSIG. ATR 42.4 BPM. ISIP 3875 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER. LEFT FRACHEAD ON BOPs. BLIND RAMS
WOULD NOT FULLYCLOSE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Pmperty:055517

FLOWEDWELL 21 HRSON 32/64"CHOKE. FCP 450 PSIG. 20 BFPH. RECOVERED712 BLW. 3495 BLWTR.
09-24-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 37 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED2 HRSON AN OPEN CHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. PUMPED 8$ BBLS TREATED WATER DOWN CASING. RIH

W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMPOFF SUB. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS@10,225', 10,359' & 10,882'. RIH,
CLEANEDOUT TO CIBP@11,100'. LANDEDTUBING@l 1,061'KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPED BALL&
PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.

FLOWED 10 HRSON 24/64"CHOKE. FTP 500 PSIG. CP 500 PSIG. 5-7 BFPH. RECOVERED180BLW. 3762
BLWTR,

TUBINGDETAIL: LENGTH
PUMP OFFASSEMBLY .91'

i JT 2-3/8" 4.7# NB0 EUETUBING 32.61'
XN NIPPLE I.25'

337JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 TUBING 11,012.35'

BELOW KB 14.00'

LANDEDAT 11,061.12' KB
09-25-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 38 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RDMOSU.

FLOWED24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1125 PSIG. 1-3 BFPH. RECOVERED 69 BLW.3513 BLWTR.
09-26-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 39 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10]12-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24,0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64"CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1000PSIG. 1 BFPH. RECOVERED75 BLW. 3438 BLWTR.
06:00
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Pmperty:055517

FLOWEDWELL 21 HRSON 32/64"CHOKE. FCP 450 PSIG. 20 BFPH. RECOVERED712 BLW. 3495 BLWTR.
09-24-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 37 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED2 HRSON AN OPEN CHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. PUMPED 8$ BBLS TREATED WATER DOWN CASING. RIH

W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMPOFF SUB. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS@10,225', 10,359' & 10,882'. RIH,
CLEANEDOUT TO CIBP@11,100'. LANDEDTUBING@l 1,061'KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPED BALL&
PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.

FLOWED 10 HRSON 24/64"CHOKE. FTP 500 PSIG. CP 500 PSIG. 5-7 BFPH. RECOVERED180BLW. 3762
BLWTR,

TUBINGDETAIL: LENGTH
PUMP OFFASSEMBLY .91'

i JT 2-3/8" 4.7# NB0 EUETUBING 32.61'
XN NIPPLE I.25'

337JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 TUBING 11,012.35'

BELOW KB 14.00'

LANDEDAT 11,061.12' KB
09-25-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 38 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RDMOSU.

FLOWED24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1125 PSIG. 1-3 BFPH. RECOVERED 69 BLW.3513 BLWTR.
09-26-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 39 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10]12-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24,0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64"CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1000PSIG. 1 BFPH. RECOVERED75 BLW. 3438 BLWTR.
06:00
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Pmperty:055517

FLOWEDWELL 21 HRSON 32/64"CHOKE. FCP 450 PSIG. 20 BFPH. RECOVERED712 BLW. 3495 BLWTR.
09-24-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 37 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED2 HRSON AN OPEN CHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. PUMPED 8$ BBLS TREATED WATER DOWN CASING. RIH

W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMPOFF SUB. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS@10,225', 10,359' & 10,882'. RIH,
CLEANEDOUT TO CIBP@11,100'. LANDEDTUBING@l 1,061'KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPED BALL&
PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.

FLOWED 10 HRSON 24/64"CHOKE. FTP 500 PSIG. CP 500 PSIG. 5-7 BFPH. RECOVERED180BLW. 3762
BLWTR,

TUBINGDETAIL: LENGTH
PUMP OFFASSEMBLY .91'

i JT 2-3/8" 4.7# NB0 EUETUBING 32.61'
XN NIPPLE I.25'

337JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 TUBING 11,012.35'

BELOW KB 14.00'

LANDEDAT 11,061.12' KB
09-25-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 38 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RDMOSU.

FLOWED24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1125 PSIG. 1-3 BFPH. RECOVERED 69 BLW.3513 BLWTR.
09-26-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 39 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10]12-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24,0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64"CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1000PSIG. 1 BFPH. RECOVERED75 BLW. 3438 BLWTR.
06:00
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:0555l7

09-27-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 40 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP400 PSIG. CP 1050 PSIG. 1-2 BFPH. TRACEOF CONDENSATE.
RECOVERED 75 BLW.3363 BLWTR.

09-28-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 41 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS, 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 800 PSIG. CP 1450 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.
RECOVERED 60 BLW. 3303 BLWTR.

09-29-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I1652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI - WO FURTHER ACTIVITY

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 FLOWED 6 HRSON 12/64"CHOKE. FTP 750 PSIG. CP 1500 PSIG. 3-5 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.
RECOVERED 24 BLW. 3279 BLWTR. SI.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:0555l7

09-27-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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Start End Hrs Activity Description
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06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS, 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 800 PSIG. CP 1450 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.
RECOVERED 60 BLW. 3303 BLWTR.

09-29-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I1652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
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- STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UT ST ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITOr CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLforrn for suchproposals

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STATE 1-32

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR; 9. API NUMBER

EOG RESOURCES, INC L. 4304735839
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX250 BIG PINEY WY ,83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 2152' FNL - 2067' FWL coUNTY; UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart; CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: DRILLING
coNVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPERATIONS

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please see the attached well chronology report for drillingoperations from 8/07/2004 - 10/06/2004.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT Kaylene R. Gardner

SIGNATU

TITLEe Regtda00oryAssistant

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
OCT12 2004

(5/2000) (See Instructions onReverse Side) OFOILGAS&

- STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
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TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart; CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
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(5/2000) (See Instructions onReverse Side) OFOILGAS&



O O

WELL CHRONOLOGY

Ueog resources REPORT

e womy y a Report Generated On: 10-06-2004

Well Name STATE01-32 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIG SPRING API # 43447--35839 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/ 11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/5,571

Location Section 32, TIOS, RISE, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL& COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES,INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total DHC / CWC 1,340,000/768,600

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-23-2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW)

SECTION32, T108, RIBE

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

TD: 11,700'BLACKHAWK

TRUERIG #9

WC/GAS
BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML-48380

ELEVATION: 5572' NAT GL, 5571' PREP GL, 5585' KB (14')

EOGWI 50%,NRI 43.75%

DOMINION EXPLORATION& PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIETROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :

O O

WELL CHRONOLOGY

Ueog resources REPORT

e womy y a Report Generated On: 10-06-2004

Well Name STATE01-32 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIG SPRING API # 43447--35839 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/ 11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/5,571

Location Section 32, TIOS, RISE, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL& COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES,INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total DHC / CWC 1,340,000/768,600

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-23-2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW)

SECTION32, T108, RIBE

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

TD: 11,700'BLACKHAWK

TRUERIG #9

WC/GAS
BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML-48380

ELEVATION: 5572' NAT GL, 5571' PREP GL, 5585' KB (14')

EOGWI 50%,NRI 43.75%

DOMINION EXPLORATION& PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIETROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :

O O

WELL CHRONOLOGY

Ueog resources REPORT

e womy y a Report Generated On: 10-06-2004

Well Name STATE01-32 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIG SPRING API # 43447--35839 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/ 11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/5,571

Location Section 32, TIOS, RISE, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL& COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES,INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total DHC / CWC 1,340,000/768,600

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-23-2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion 50 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling 50 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW)

SECTION32, T108, RIBE

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

TD: 11,700'BLACKHAWK

TRUERIG #9

WC/GAS
BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML-48380

ELEVATION: 5572' NAT GL, 5571' PREP GL, 5585' KB (14')

EOGWI 50%,NRI 43.75%

DOMINION EXPLORATION& PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIETROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :



WellName:STATE01--32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUCRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17½ "HOLE@ 3:00PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED 17 1/2"HOLETO 230'. RAN 5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#/FT, H-40, ST&CCASING& LANDED@
238.90' KB. RUBIG4 CEMENTING. PRESSURE TESTEDLINES AND CEMENT VALVETO 1000PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED 20 BBLS GELLED WATER & 20 BBLSWATER FLUSH AHEADOF CEMENT. MIXED & PUMPED 225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENT W/2% CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXEDCEMENT@15.8 PPGW/YIELD OF l.15
CF/SX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT W/29 BBLSWATER& SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE. HAD 12BBLS
CEMENTRETURNSTO SURFACE. RD BIG 4. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARYRIG. WORT WILL DROP
FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHERACTIVITY.

ED TROTTER NGTIFIED CAROL DANIELSW/UOGM OF SPUDDINGWELLAT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling . Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling .--- Completion Well Total

MD 1,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRU TRUE RIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER, HCRAND HOOK UP CHOKELINES.

13:30 14:30 1.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHPS1BIT,5/6 LOBE4 STAGEMOTOR, SHOCKSUBAND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT 214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILLCEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP 214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30¯ ¯¯ 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 229' TO 285' (56') 56*/NR 18/20K WOB, 145 BlT RPM. ¯¯

16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILLROTATE285' TO 350' (65') 65'lHR. 20/22K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588'(238') 47.6'/HR. 22/25KWOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @503', 3/4 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL ROTATE 588' TO 1005'(417') 69.5'/HR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIG ON DAYWORK 10:00AM, 8/12/04

NOTIFIED UTAH DNR (CARROL DANIELS)OF INTENT TO SPUD @08:30 8/12/04

FUEL AT START OF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETY MEETING: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNING SLICK LINESURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7-7/8" HOLE AT 3:30 PM, 8/12/04

08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING
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WellName:STATE01--32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517
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Start End Hrs Activity Description
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DRILLED 17 1/2"HOLETO 230'. RAN 5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#/FT, H-40, ST&CCASING& LANDED@
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08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR
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16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILLROTATE285' TO 350' (65') 65'lHR. 20/22K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588'(238') 47.6'/HR. 22/25KWOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @503', 3/4 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL ROTATE 588' TO 1005'(417') 69.5'/HR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIG ON DAYWORK 10:00AM, 8/12/04

NOTIFIED UTAH DNR (CARROL DANIELS)OF INTENT TO SPUD @08:30 8/12/04

FUEL AT START OF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETY MEETING: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNING SLICK LINESURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7-7/8" HOLE AT 3:30 PM, 8/12/04

08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING
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WellName:STATE01--32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUCRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17½ "HOLE@ 3:00PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED 17 1/2"HOLETO 230'. RAN 5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#/FT, H-40, ST&CCASING& LANDED@
238.90' KB. RUBIG4 CEMENTING. PRESSURE TESTEDLINES AND CEMENT VALVETO 1000PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED 20 BBLS GELLED WATER & 20 BBLSWATER FLUSH AHEADOF CEMENT. MIXED & PUMPED 225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENT W/2% CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXEDCEMENT@15.8 PPGW/YIELD OF l.15
CF/SX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT W/29 BBLSWATER& SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE. HAD 12BBLS
CEMENTRETURNSTO SURFACE. RD BIG 4. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARYRIG. WORT WILL DROP
FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHERACTIVITY.

ED TROTTER NGTIFIED CAROL DANIELSW/UOGM OF SPUDDINGWELLAT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling . Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling .--- Completion Well Total

MD 1,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRU TRUE RIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER, HCRAND HOOK UP CHOKELINES.

13:30 14:30 1.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHPS1BIT,5/6 LOBE4 STAGEMOTOR, SHOCKSUBAND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT 214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILLCEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP 214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30¯ ¯¯ 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 229' TO 285' (56') 56*/NR 18/20K WOB, 145 BlT RPM. ¯¯

16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILLROTATE285' TO 350' (65') 65'lHR. 20/22K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588'(238') 47.6'/HR. 22/25KWOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @503', 3/4 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL ROTATE 588' TO 1005'(417') 69.5'/HR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIG ON DAYWORK 10:00AM, 8/12/04

NOTIFIED UTAH DNR (CARROL DANIELS)OF INTENT TO SPUD @08:30 8/12/04

FUEL AT START OF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETY MEETING: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNING SLICK LINESURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7-7/8" HOLE AT 3:30 PM, 8/12/04

08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRINp Property:055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1005' TO 1117' (I12') 74.6'lHR, 38/40KWOB, 155RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY @1048', 3/4 DEG.

08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1117' TO 1365' (248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45KWOB, 127RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTEST DIVERTER.

11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE1365'TO 1610' (245') 61.2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540', 2 1/2DEG.

15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1610' TO 1927' (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48KWOB, 130RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @1843', 2 3/4 DEG.

22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1927' TO 2260'(333') 44.4'/HR, 45/48KWOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: REPAIR PUMP/WORKINGWITHNEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY

TEMP58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS
BGG-72, CG-378

08-15--2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHORT TRIP PRIORTO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE2260' TO 2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @2300', l 1/4 DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.S'/HR,48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

11:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2457' TO 2865' (408') 45.3'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY @2780', 2 DEG.

20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 2865' TO 3200' (335') 44.6'lHR, 48/52KWOS, 45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSINGWATERAT ±3000'

LOSTTOTALOF 640 BBLSEST.

04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3113', I DEG.

04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WlTH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIPTO DRILL COLLARS. HOLE TAKING2 TIMES NORMAL FILL

SAFETYMEETING: RUNNING FORK LIFT, WIRE LINE SURVEYS

TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION:GREEN RIVER 20% SH, 35% SS, 45% LS

BGG 34, CG 43

08- 04 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRINp Property:055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1005' TO 1117' (I12') 74.6'lHR, 38/40KWOB, 155RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY @1048', 3/4 DEG.

08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1117' TO 1365' (248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45KWOB, 127RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTEST DIVERTER.

11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE1365'TO 1610' (245') 61.2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540', 2 1/2DEG.

15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1610' TO 1927' (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48KWOB, 130RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @1843', 2 3/4 DEG.

22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1927' TO 2260'(333') 44.4'/HR, 45/48KWOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: REPAIR PUMP/WORKINGWITHNEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY

TEMP58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS
BGG-72, CG-378

08-15--2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHORT TRIP PRIORTO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE2260' TO 2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @2300', l 1/4 DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.S'/HR,48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

11:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2457' TO 2865' (408') 45.3'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY @2780', 2 DEG.

20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 2865' TO 3200' (335') 44.6'lHR, 48/52KWOS, 45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSINGWATERAT ±3000'

LOSTTOTALOF 640 BBLSEST.

04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3113', I DEG.

04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WlTH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIPTO DRILL COLLARS. HOLE TAKING2 TIMES NORMAL FILL

SAFETYMEETING: RUNNING FORK LIFT, WIRE LINE SURVEYS

TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION:GREEN RIVER 20% SH, 35% SS, 45% LS

BGG 34, CG 43

08- 04 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Page

Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRINp Property:055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1005' TO 1117' (I12') 74.6'lHR, 38/40KWOB, 155RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY @1048', 3/4 DEG.

08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1117' TO 1365' (248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45KWOB, 127RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTEST DIVERTER.

11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE1365'TO 1610' (245') 61.2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540', 2 1/2DEG.

15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1610' TO 1927' (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48KWOB, 130RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @1843', 2 3/4 DEG.

22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL& ROTATE 1927' TO 2260'(333') 44.4'/HR, 45/48KWOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: REPAIR PUMP/WORKINGWITHNEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY

TEMP58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS
BGG-72, CG-378

08-15--2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHORT TRIP PRIORTO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE2260' TO 2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @2300', l 1/4 DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.S'/HR,48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

11:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2457' TO 2865' (408') 45.3'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY @2780', 2 DEG.

20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 2865' TO 3200' (335') 44.6'lHR, 48/52KWOS, 45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSINGWATERAT ±3000'

LOSTTOTALOF 640 BBLSEST.

04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3113', I DEG.

04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WlTH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIPTO DRILL COLLARS. HOLE TAKING2 TIMES NORMAL FILL

SAFETYMEETING: RUNNING FORK LIFT, WIRE LINE SURVEYS

TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION:GREEN RIVER 20% SH, 35% SS, 45% LS

BGG 34, CG 43

08- 04 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE,NO FILL, NO DRAG.

07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL& ROTATE3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATEDBUTTOMSUP, CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILLADDITIONAL 89'DUE TO DRILLBREAKS.

08:00 I I:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'lHR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE.CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.

12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & RUTATE 3314' TO 3358'(44') 44'lHR, 48/50KWOB,45/82 RPM.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED DIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'lHR, 48/50KWOB,45/82 RPM.

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATEBOTTOMSUP. SPUT 75 BBLS LCM PILL ON BOTTOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIGUP LAY DOWN MACHINE. LAID DOWN 3 - 8" COLLARS,MOTOR AND SHOCK SUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELD PRE-JOB SAFETY MEETING, RlG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASING AS FOLLOWS:GUIDESHOE, 1 FLOAT
JOINT,FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RAN TUTAL OF 77 JTS 9 S/8",36#, J-55, STC CASING, CASING SHOE
LANDED AT 3400', FLOATCOLLAR AT 3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS 5'ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,
THENEVERYSTH JT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOMOF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUGRETAINER. CIRCULATED BUTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCH TO SCHLUMBERGER,LEAD Wl285 SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12%D20, 1%D79, .25% D112, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0 PPG,YIELD 3.91.TAIL WITH 320 SXS "G" W/10% D53, 2% $1, .25 PPS D29,MIXEDAT
14.2 PPGYIELD 1.61. DROPPEDPLUGAND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLSWATER,DIDNOT BUMP PLUG, HAD
FULLRETURNSTHROUGHOUT JOB WITH 50 BBLS CEMENT TO SURFACE. RELEASE PSI, FLOAT EQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER,SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSG WITH 98K STRINGWT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUEND DIVERTER AND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETYMEETING:OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NGTIFIED UTAH DOG&M OF INTENTTO SETANDCEMENT INTERMEDIATE CASING(LEFT CAROL
DANIELSA MESSAGE) AT 09:30 AM, 8/15/04

RECIEVED73 JTS 9 5/8" CASING FROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TOTAL PIPE ON LOCATION
3451'

FORMATION: GREENRIVER35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINALCUT ON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAMETO 1800PSL

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOG WITHSCHLUMBERGERWHILE NU BOP'S.
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE,NO FILL, NO DRAG.

07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL& ROTATE3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATEDBUTTOMSUP, CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILLADDITIONAL 89'DUE TO DRILLBREAKS.

08:00 I I:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'lHR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE.CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.

12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & RUTATE 3314' TO 3358'(44') 44'lHR, 48/50KWOB,45/82 RPM.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED DIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'lHR, 48/50KWOB,45/82 RPM.

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATEBOTTOMSUP. SPUT 75 BBLS LCM PILL ON BOTTOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIGUP LAY DOWN MACHINE. LAID DOWN 3 - 8" COLLARS,MOTOR AND SHOCK SUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELD PRE-JOB SAFETY MEETING, RlG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASING AS FOLLOWS:GUIDESHOE, 1 FLOAT
JOINT,FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RAN TUTAL OF 77 JTS 9 S/8",36#, J-55, STC CASING, CASING SHOE
LANDED AT 3400', FLOATCOLLAR AT 3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS 5'ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,
THENEVERYSTH JT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOMOF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUGRETAINER. CIRCULATED BUTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCH TO SCHLUMBERGER,LEAD Wl285 SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12%D20, 1%D79, .25% D112, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0 PPG,YIELD 3.91.TAIL WITH 320 SXS "G" W/10% D53, 2% $1, .25 PPS D29,MIXEDAT
14.2 PPGYIELD 1.61. DROPPEDPLUGAND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLSWATER,DIDNOT BUMP PLUG, HAD
FULLRETURNSTHROUGHOUT JOB WITH 50 BBLS CEMENT TO SURFACE. RELEASE PSI, FLOAT EQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER,SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSG WITH 98K STRINGWT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUEND DIVERTER AND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETYMEETING:OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NGTIFIED UTAH DOG&M OF INTENTTO SETANDCEMENT INTERMEDIATE CASING(LEFT CAROL
DANIELSA MESSAGE) AT 09:30 AM, 8/15/04

RECIEVED73 JTS 9 5/8" CASING FROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TOTAL PIPE ON LOCATION
3451'

FORMATION: GREENRIVER35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINALCUT ON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAMETO 1800PSL

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOG WITHSCHLUMBERGERWHILE NU BOP'S.
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE,NO FILL, NO DRAG.

07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL& ROTATE3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATEDBUTTOMSUP, CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILLADDITIONAL 89'DUE TO DRILLBREAKS.

08:00 I I:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'lHR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE.CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.

12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & RUTATE 3314' TO 3358'(44') 44'lHR, 48/50KWOB,45/82 RPM.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED DIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'lHR, 48/50KWOB,45/82 RPM.

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATEBOTTOMSUP. SPUT 75 BBLS LCM PILL ON BOTTOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIGUP LAY DOWN MACHINE. LAID DOWN 3 - 8" COLLARS,MOTOR AND SHOCK SUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELD PRE-JOB SAFETY MEETING, RlG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASING AS FOLLOWS:GUIDESHOE, 1 FLOAT
JOINT,FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RAN TUTAL OF 77 JTS 9 S/8",36#, J-55, STC CASING, CASING SHOE
LANDED AT 3400', FLOATCOLLAR AT 3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS 5'ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,
THENEVERYSTH JT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOMOF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUGRETAINER. CIRCULATED BUTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCH TO SCHLUMBERGER,LEAD Wl285 SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12%D20, 1%D79, .25% D112, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0 PPG,YIELD 3.91.TAIL WITH 320 SXS "G" W/10% D53, 2% $1, .25 PPS D29,MIXEDAT
14.2 PPGYIELD 1.61. DROPPEDPLUGAND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLSWATER,DIDNOT BUMP PLUG, HAD
FULLRETURNSTHROUGHOUT JOB WITH 50 BBLS CEMENT TO SURFACE. RELEASE PSI, FLOAT EQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER,SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSG WITH 98K STRINGWT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUEND DIVERTER AND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETYMEETING:OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NGTIFIED UTAH DOG&M OF INTENTTO SETANDCEMENT INTERMEDIATE CASING(LEFT CAROL
DANIELSA MESSAGE) AT 09:30 AM, 8/15/04

RECIEVED73 JTS 9 5/8" CASING FROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TOTAL PIPE ON LOCATION
3451'

FORMATION: GREENRIVER35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINALCUT ON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAMETO 1800PSL

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOG WITHSCHLUMBERGERWHILE NU BOP'S.
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BlG SPRING Property:055517

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTED BLINDRAMS,PIPE RAMS,FLOORVALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATEDVALVESTO 250 & 5000 PSI.
TESTED HYDRIL250 & 2500 PSI WITHB&CQUICKTEST, ALL TESTS 10MINUTES. TESTEDCASINGTO 1500
PS1 FOR 30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLED WEARBUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKEUP HYCALOG DSX210 JETTED ,85 TFA ON A HUNTING7/8 LOBE2.9 STAGE MOTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLE WITH SAMETO TOP OF CEMENT.

19:00 20:30 1.5 DRILLCEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10' NEW HOLE TO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FIT TESTTO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENTWITH8.4 PPG WATER IN HOLEAND 690 PSI. APPLIEDPS1,
HELD FOR 15 MIN,OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL& ROTATE W/MOTOR3410'TO 3680'(270') 77.l'lHR, 18KWOB, 57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @3598', 1/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3680' TO 4115'(435') 87'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTING/NU BOP/CUT DRILLLINE

TEMP63 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, i5% SLTST, 35% LS

BGG 34, CG 83, HG 465

08--18-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress I,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1 0 DRILL & ROTATE W/MOTOR4115' TO 4198' (83') 83'/HR, I SK WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFE

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 4198' TO 4668' (470') 94'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFE

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL& ROTATE 4668' TO Sl75'(507') 92.l'/HR, 20/22K WOB,57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @5095', 1 1/2 DEG.

19:00 06:00 l1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 5175' TO 6040' (865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:SLINGINGPIPEFROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROM V-DOOR/SLICKLINESURVEYSIBOP
DRILL 1 MIN 40 SEC
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH @4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15% SLTST, 5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BlG SPRING Property:055517

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTED BLINDRAMS,PIPE RAMS,FLOORVALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATEDVALVESTO 250 & 5000 PSI.
TESTED HYDRIL250 & 2500 PSI WITHB&CQUICKTEST, ALL TESTS 10MINUTES. TESTEDCASINGTO 1500
PS1 FOR 30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLED WEARBUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKEUP HYCALOG DSX210 JETTED ,85 TFA ON A HUNTING7/8 LOBE2.9 STAGE MOTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLE WITH SAMETO TOP OF CEMENT.

19:00 20:30 1.5 DRILLCEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10' NEW HOLE TO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FIT TESTTO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENTWITH8.4 PPG WATER IN HOLEAND 690 PSI. APPLIEDPS1,
HELD FOR 15 MIN,OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL& ROTATE W/MOTOR3410'TO 3680'(270') 77.l'lHR, 18KWOB, 57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @3598', 1/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3680' TO 4115'(435') 87'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTING/NU BOP/CUT DRILLLINE

TEMP63 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, i5% SLTST, 35% LS

BGG 34, CG 83, HG 465

08--18-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress I,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1 0 DRILL & ROTATE W/MOTOR4115' TO 4198' (83') 83'/HR, I SK WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFE

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 4198' TO 4668' (470') 94'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFE

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL& ROTATE 4668' TO Sl75'(507') 92.l'/HR, 20/22K WOB,57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @5095', 1 1/2 DEG.

19:00 06:00 l1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 5175' TO 6040' (865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:SLINGINGPIPEFROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROM V-DOOR/SLICKLINESURVEYSIBOP
DRILL 1 MIN 40 SEC
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH @4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15% SLTST, 5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BlG SPRING Property:055517

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTED BLINDRAMS,PIPE RAMS,FLOORVALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATEDVALVESTO 250 & 5000 PSI.
TESTED HYDRIL250 & 2500 PSI WITHB&CQUICKTEST, ALL TESTS 10MINUTES. TESTEDCASINGTO 1500
PS1 FOR 30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLED WEARBUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKEUP HYCALOG DSX210 JETTED ,85 TFA ON A HUNTING7/8 LOBE2.9 STAGE MOTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLE WITH SAMETO TOP OF CEMENT.

19:00 20:30 1.5 DRILLCEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10' NEW HOLE TO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FIT TESTTO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENTWITH8.4 PPG WATER IN HOLEAND 690 PSI. APPLIEDPS1,
HELD FOR 15 MIN,OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL& ROTATE W/MOTOR3410'TO 3680'(270') 77.l'lHR, 18KWOB, 57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @3598', 1/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3680' TO 4115'(435') 87'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTING/NU BOP/CUT DRILLLINE

TEMP63 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, i5% SLTST, 35% LS

BGG 34, CG 83, HG 465

08--18-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress I,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1 0 DRILL & ROTATE W/MOTOR4115' TO 4198' (83') 83'/HR, I SK WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFE

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 4198' TO 4668' (470') 94'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFE

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL& ROTATE 4668' TO Sl75'(507') 92.l'/HR, 20/22K WOB,57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @5095', 1 1/2 DEG.

19:00 06:00 l1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 5175' TO 6040' (865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:SLINGINGPIPEFROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROM V-DOOR/SLICKLINESURVEYSIBOP
DRILL 1 MIN 40 SEC
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH @4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15% SLTST, 5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE01--32 Field:BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATE WlMOTOR6040' TO 6146' (106') 106'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM,200--250 DIFF. BOPDRILL
1 MIN, 40 SEC.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @6064', 1 3/4 DEG.

07:30 1I:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE 6146' TO 6451' (305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTEDHYDRILL,FLOOR VALVES& CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC. BOP DRILL
DAYS1MIN, 50 SEC.

12:00 23:30 11.5 DRILL ROTATE6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.I'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @7089', 2 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL& ROTATE 7131' TO 7470' (339') 56.5'/HR, 18/22K WOB,22/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:CHANGINGOIL/LOADING AND UNLOADING/WORKINGINRAIN

TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION:NORTH HORN @6300', 65% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST

08-20-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal

MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL& ROTATE W/MOTOR 7470' TO 7809' (339') 48.4'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPERAMS,HYDRIL & CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC.

13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE7809' TO 8384' (575') 34.8'lHR, 18/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

STARTEDLlGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETY MEETING:MIXINGCHEMICAL/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION:DARKCANYON TOP @8280', 79% SH, 20% SS, 10% SLTST

08-21-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILLROTATE8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100 DIFF.

08:00 12:00 4.0 SLUG,DROP SURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLEFOR BIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAG ON FIRST5 STANDS,CLEAN
WITH NO DRAGAFTERTHAT. SURVEY @8400'- 2 DEG.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTIONTEST BLINDS,RAMS, CHOKE,FLOOR VALVES.
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Well Name: STATE01--32 Field:BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATE WlMOTOR6040' TO 6146' (106') 106'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM,200--250 DIFF. BOPDRILL
1 MIN, 40 SEC.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @6064', 1 3/4 DEG.

07:30 1I:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE 6146' TO 6451' (305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTEDHYDRILL,FLOOR VALVES& CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC. BOP DRILL

DAYS1MIN, 50 SEC.

12:00 23:30 11.5 DRILL ROTATE6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.I'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @7089', 2 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL& ROTATE 7131' TO 7470' (339') 56.5'/HR, 18/22K WOB,22/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:CHANGINGOIL/LOADING AND UNLOADING/WORKINGINRAIN

TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION:NORTH HORN @6300', 65% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST

08-20-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal

MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL& ROTATE W/MOTOR 7470' TO 7809' (339') 48.4'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPERAMS,HYDRIL & CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC.

13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE7809' TO 8384' (575') 34.8'lHR, 18/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

STARTEDLlGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETY MEETING:MIXINGCHEMICAL/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION:DARKCANYON TOP @8280', 79% SH, 20% SS, 10% SLTST

08-21-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILLROTATE8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100 DIFF.

08:00 12:00 4.0 SLUG,DROP SURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLEFOR BIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAG ON FIRST5 STANDS,CLEAN
WITH NO DRAGAFTERTHAT. SURVEY @8400'- 2 DEG.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTIONTEST BLINDS,RAMS, CHOKE,FLOOR VALVES.
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Well Name: STATE01--32 Field:BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATE WlMOTOR6040' TO 6146' (106') 106'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM,200--250 DIFF. BOPDRILL
1 MIN, 40 SEC.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @6064', 1 3/4 DEG.

07:30 1I:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE 6146' TO 6451' (305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTEDHYDRILL,FLOOR VALVES& CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC. BOP DRILL

DAYS1MIN, 50 SEC.

12:00 23:30 11.5 DRILL ROTATE6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.I'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @7089', 2 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL& ROTATE 7131' TO 7470' (339') 56.5'/HR, 18/22K WOB,22/46RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:CHANGINGOIL/LOADING AND UNLOADING/WORKINGINRAIN

TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION:NORTH HORN @6300', 65% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST

08-20-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal

MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL& ROTATE W/MOTOR 7470' TO 7809' (339') 48.4'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPERAMS,HYDRIL & CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC.

13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE7809' TO 8384' (575') 34.8'lHR, 18/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

STARTEDLlGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETY MEETING:MIXINGCHEMICAL/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION:DARKCANYON TOP @8280', 79% SH, 20% SS, 10% SLTST

08-21-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILLROTATE8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100 DIFF.

08:00 12:00 4.0 SLUG,DROP SURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLEFOR BIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAG ON FIRST5 STANDS,CLEAN
WITH NO DRAGAFTERTHAT. SURVEY @8400'- 2 DEG.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTIONTEST BLINDS,RAMS, CHOKE,FLOOR VALVES.

Page



Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 - HTC HC506Z JETTEDWITH0.66" TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT ROLLER REAMERS (ONE AT 30' &
OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGE BUTTON CUTTERS ON EACH, TRIP IN HOLE WITH SAME.

16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30' OF FlLL ON BOTTOM. PATTERN BIT.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL 8429' TO 9090' (661') 48.9'/HR. 28/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNINGWATERAROUNDELECTlCALOUTLETS,TRIPPING,IMPORTANCEOF USlNG
STATIC LINE.

WEATHER:58 DEG. PARTLY CLOUDY, CALM

FORMATION: PRICE RIVERTOP@8549', 40%SH,-50% SS, 10%SLTST.

BGG-30, CG-52, TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 l I:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') 55.6'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY@9326'-2 I/4 DEG.

12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'lHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. RAISE WT. TO 9.5 PPGAT 9400'

17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL,FLOORVALVES.

17:30 18:00 0.5 CHANGEOUT ROTATING HEAD INSERT AND FLOW SENSOR.

18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL 9675' TO 10195'(520') 43.3'lHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10 PPG PRIORTO THE
BLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.

WEATHER53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST,20% CARB SH.

BGG 3747, CG 1306, HIGH GAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 MW 10.5 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL,FLOORVALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 1022TTO 10250'(23') 5.l'/HR. 14/30K WOB. 58 RPM.

12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #4. BIT WORN FLAT ON SHOULDERTO MATRIX.INNER
CUTTERSIN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TESTBLINDRAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX146HGJW AND TRIP IN HOLE TO CASINGSHOE.

20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 - HTC HC506Z JETTEDWITH0.66" TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT ROLLER REAMERS (ONE AT 30' &
OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGE BUTTON CUTTERS ON EACH, TRIP IN HOLE WITH SAME.

16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30' OF FlLL ON BOTTOM. PATTERN BIT.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL 8429' TO 9090' (661') 48.9'/HR. 28/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNINGWATERAROUNDELECTlCALOUTLETS,TRIPPING,IMPORTANCEOF USlNG
STATIC LINE.

WEATHER:58 DEG. PARTLY CLOUDY, CALM

FORMATION: PRICE RIVERTOP@8549', 40%SH,-50% SS, 10%SLTST.

BGG-30, CG-52, TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 l I:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') 55.6'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY@9326'-2 I/4 DEG.

12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'lHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. RAISE WT. TO 9.5 PPGAT 9400'

17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL,FLOORVALVES.

17:30 18:00 0.5 CHANGEOUT ROTATING HEAD INSERT AND FLOW SENSOR.

18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL 9675' TO 10195'(520') 43.3'lHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10 PPG PRIORTO THE
BLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.

WEATHER53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST,20% CARB SH.

BGG 3747, CG 1306, HIGH GAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 MW 10.5 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL,FLOORVALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 1022TTO 10250'(23') 5.l'/HR. 14/30K WOB. 58 RPM.

12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #4. BIT WORN FLAT ON SHOULDERTO MATRIX.INNER
CUTTERSIN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TESTBLINDRAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX146HGJW AND TRIP IN HOLE TO CASINGSHOE.

20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 - HTC HC506Z JETTEDWITH0.66" TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT ROLLER REAMERS (ONE AT 30' &
OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGE BUTTON CUTTERS ON EACH, TRIP IN HOLE WITH SAME.

16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30' OF FlLL ON BOTTOM. PATTERN BIT.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL 8429' TO 9090' (661') 48.9'/HR. 28/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNINGWATERAROUNDELECTlCALOUTLETS,TRIPPING,IMPORTANCEOF USlNG
STATIC LINE.

WEATHER:58 DEG. PARTLY CLOUDY, CALM

FORMATION: PRICE RIVERTOP@8549', 40%SH,-50% SS, 10%SLTST.

BGG-30, CG-52, TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 l I:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') 55.6'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY@9326'-2 I/4 DEG.

12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'lHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. RAISE WT. TO 9.5 PPGAT 9400'

17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL,FLOORVALVES.

17:30 18:00 0.5 CHANGEOUT ROTATING HEAD INSERT AND FLOW SENSOR.

18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL 9675' TO 10195'(520') 43.3'lHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10 PPG PRIORTO THE
BLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.

WEATHER53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST,20% CARB SH.

BGG 3747, CG 1306, HIGH GAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 MW 10.5 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL,FLOORVALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 1022TTO 10250'(23') 5.l'/HR. 14/30K WOB. 58 RPM.

12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #4. BIT WORN FLAT ON SHOULDERTO MATRIX.INNER
CUTTERSIN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TESTBLINDRAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX146HGJW AND TRIP IN HOLE TO CASINGSHOE.

20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISH IN HOLE FILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.

01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM 71' TO BOTTOM SLOWLY TORQUEY LAST 20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'/HR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:CHAlNS,HOSES,ETC.AROUND ROTARYTABLE, TRIPPINGAND CUTTINGDRILL LINE

WEATHER: 57 DEG,FAIR, WIND WEST @5 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 50% SH, 35%SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH.

BGG 2353,CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280,HIGHGAS 5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 ProgreSS 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304'(14') 9.3'lHR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGED SWAB& SEAT IN PUMPS.

08:00 ll:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304'TO 10,350'(46') 13.l'lHR, 14/16K WOB,55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDHYDRIL & FLOOR VALVES.

12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350'TO 10,708'(358') 19.8'/HR, 16/18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWERPRICERIVER @10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD,5% SLTST, 45% CARBSH, 5% COAL

BGG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES >1'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress - 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708' TO 10,846'{I38') 27.6'/HR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTEDPIPE RAMS,HYDRIL AND HCR.

I I:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846' TO l 1,046'(200') 10.8'/HR, 18K WOB, SSRPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICALREPAIRIUNLOADINGCSG

TEMP 50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP @10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, 10% COAL

BGG 2799, CG 5849, HIGH GAS4269
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISH IN HOLE FILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.

01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM 71' TO BOTTOM SLOWLY TORQUEY LAST 20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'/HR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:CHAlNS,HOSES,ETC.AROUND ROTARYTABLE, TRIPPINGAND CUTTINGDRILL LINE

WEATHER: 57 DEG,FAIR, WIND WEST @5 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 50% SH, 35%SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH.

BGG 2353,CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280,HIGHGAS 5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 ProgreSS 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304'(14') 9.3'lHR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGED SWAB& SEAT IN PUMPS.

08:00 ll:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304'TO 10,350'(46') 13.l'lHR, 14/16K WOB,55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDHYDRIL & FLOOR VALVES.

12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350'TO 10,708'(358') 19.8'/HR, 16/18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWERPRICERIVER @10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD,5% SLTST, 45% CARBSH, 5% COAL

BGG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES >1'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress - 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708' TO 10,846'{I38') 27.6'/HR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTEDPIPE RAMS,HYDRIL AND HCR.

I I:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846' TO l 1,046'(200') 10.8'/HR, 18K WOB, SSRPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICALREPAIRIUNLOADINGCSG

TEMP 50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP @10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, 10% COAL

BGG 2799, CG 5849, HIGH GAS4269
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISH IN HOLE FILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.

01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM 71' TO BOTTOM SLOWLY TORQUEY LAST 20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'/HR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:CHAlNS,HOSES,ETC.AROUND ROTARYTABLE, TRIPPINGAND CUTTINGDRILL LINE

WEATHER: 57 DEG,FAIR, WIND WEST @5 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 50% SH, 35%SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH.

BGG 2353,CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280,HIGHGAS 5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 ProgreSS 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304'(14') 9.3'lHR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGED SWAB& SEAT IN PUMPS.

08:00 ll:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304'TO 10,350'(46') 13.l'lHR, 14/16K WOB,55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDHYDRIL & FLOOR VALVES.

12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350'TO 10,708'(358') 19.8'/HR, 16/18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWERPRICERIVER @10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD,5% SLTST, 45% CARBSH, 5% COAL

BGG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES >1'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress - 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708' TO 10,846'{I38') 27.6'/HR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTION TESTEDPIPE RAMS,HYDRIL AND HCR.

I I:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846' TO l 1,046'(200') 10.8'/HR, 18K WOB, SSRPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICALREPAIRIUNLOADINGCSG

TEMP 50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP @10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, 10% COAL

BGG 2799, CG 5849, HIGH GAS4269

Page



Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property: 055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLORICLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Visc 45.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL 11,046' TO 11,146' (100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB, 57 RPM.

17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPED SLUG. DROPPED SURVEY.TOH FOR BIT #5, NO TIGHTSPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE, INNER STRUCTURE
GOOD,WORN CUTTERS AND FLATTENED CUTTERSON OUTSIDE.

23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKE UP 81T #5, HTC HC506ZAND TIH. WASHED & REAMED LAST20' WITHOUT MUCH TORQUE.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL I1,146' TO 11,160'(14') 14 FPH, WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION:BLACKHAWK TOP@ l1,112', 35% SH, 50% SS, 5% SLTST,10% CARB SH, COAL< 5%

BGG 2200, TRIP GAS 6000

08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW 11.1 Visc 44 0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160'TO 11,650'(490') 20 FPH, WOB 18K, 56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION:SUNNYSIDE TOP @ l 1,370', 20% SH, 65% SS, 10% SLTST, 5% CARBSH

BG GAS 3284U,CONN GAS 5154U

08-28-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW 11.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNOPENHOLELOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL 11650'- 11700' TD. REACHEDTD @09:30, 8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH,WOB 19K, 56 RPM, PP 1550.

09:30 11:00 1.5 CIRCULATED FOR SHORT TRIP.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SHORTTRIP 15STANDS, NO DRAGOR FILL.

12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATED TRIP GAS OUT,6900UNITS. PUMPED PILL.

14:00 19:00 5.0 TOH FOR LOGS. SCHLUMBERGER ON LOCATION@17:00.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property: 055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLORICLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Visc 45.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL 11,046' TO 11,146' (100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB, 57 RPM.

17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPED SLUG. DROPPED SURVEY.TOH FOR BIT #5, NO TIGHTSPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE, INNER STRUCTURE

GOOD,WORN CUTTERS AND FLATTENED CUTTERSON OUTSIDE.

23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKE UP 81T #5, HTC HC506ZAND TIH. WASHED & REAMED LAST20' WITHOUT MUCH TORQUE.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL I1,146' TO 11,160'(14') 14 FPH, WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION:BLACKHAWK TOP@ l1,112', 35% SH, 50% SS, 5% SLTST,10% CARB SH, COAL< 5%

BGG 2200, TRIP GAS 6000

08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW 11.1 Visc 44 0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160'TO 11,650'(490') 20 FPH, WOB 18K, 56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION:SUNNYSIDE TOP @ l 1,370', 20% SH, 65% SS, 10% SLTST, 5% CARBSH

BG GAS 3284U,CONN GAS 5154U

08-28-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW 11.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNOPENHOLELOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL 11650'- 11700' TD. REACHEDTD @09:30, 8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH,WOB 19K, 56 RPM, PP 1550.

09:30 11:00 1.5 CIRCULATED FOR SHORT TRIP.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SHORTTRIP 15STANDS, NO DRAGOR FILL.

12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATED TRIP GAS OUT,6900UNITS. PUMPED PILL.

14:00 19:00 5.0 TOH FOR LOGS. SCHLUMBERGER ON LOCATION@17:00.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property: 055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLORICLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Visc 45.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL 11,046' TO 11,146' (100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB, 57 RPM.

17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPED SLUG. DROPPED SURVEY.TOH FOR BIT #5, NO TIGHTSPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE, INNER STRUCTURE

GOOD,WORN CUTTERS AND FLATTENED CUTTERSON OUTSIDE.

23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKE UP 81T #5, HTC HC506ZAND TIH. WASHED & REAMED LAST20' WITHOUT MUCH TORQUE.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL I1,146' TO 11,160'(14') 14 FPH, WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION:BLACKHAWK TOP@ l1,112', 35% SH, 50% SS, 5% SLTST,10% CARB SH, COAL< 5%

BGG 2200, TRIP GAS 6000

08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW 11.1 Visc 44 0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160'TO 11,650'(490') 20 FPH, WOB 18K, 56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION:SUNNYSIDE TOP @ l 1,370', 20% SH, 65% SS, 10% SLTST, 5% CARBSH

BG GAS 3284U,CONN GAS 5154U

08-28-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW 11.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNOPENHOLELOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL 11650'- 11700' TD. REACHEDTD @09:30, 8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH,WOB 19K, 56 RPM, PP 1550.

09:30 11:00 1.5 CIRCULATED FOR SHORT TRIP.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SHORTTRIP 15STANDS, NO DRAGOR FILL.

12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATED TRIP GAS OUT,6900UNITS. PUMPED PILL.

14:00 19:00 5.0 TOH FOR LOGS. SCHLUMBERGER ON LOCATION@17:00.
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRIN6 Property: 055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETYMEETING. RU SCHLUMBERGER. LOGGINGWELL. LOGSRUN:PLATFORM EXPRESSWITH
DIPOLESONICFROM TD TO BASE OF INTCASING. ROTARY SIDEWALLCORES IN NEXTRUNS.

SAFETY MEETING: LOGGING

08-29-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FISHINGROTARY CORING TOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGW/SCHLUMBERGER. FINISHED RUNNINGPLATFORM EXPRESS& DIPOLE SONIC, LOGGERS TD
WASl1,706'.

07:00 09;00 2.0 WAITON ORDERS(CORE POINTS OFF OF LOGS). RECElVED CORE POINTSFROM GEOLOGY DEPT.

09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARY SIDEWALLCORETOOL, MADE ONE CORE@l1,653'AND WASSTUCK.

12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKEDTOOL, TRIED TO GET FREE WITHNO PROGRESS WHILE WAITINGON WEATHERFORD
FISHERMAN & TOOLS.

17:00 20:00 3.0 RUWEKTHERFORD TO STRIP OVER WIRELINE AND FISH TOOL. SAFETY MEETING:DON'T GET IN A
HURRY.

20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPING OVER WIRELINE, CAME LOOSE@4185'.

Ol:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINETOGETHER AND PULLED TOOL INTOOVERSHOT.

04:00 06:00 2,0 PULLED LINE OUT OF TOOL AND POHWlELECTRIC CABLE.

SAFETY MEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTEDCAROL DANIELS W/UOGM AT 10:30 AM, 8/26/04TO NOTIFYOF PRODUCTION CASING
CEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTEDDAN JARVIS (LEFT MESSAGE,NOAFTER-HOURS NUMBER)W/UTAH
DNRAT 11:30AM, 8-27-04 W/NOTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT,SLURRY & UPDATED TIMING
FOR PRODUCTION CEMENT JOB,

08-30-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 TOHWIDP, FISHING TOOLS & CORE TOOL(FISH). LD FISH.

09:00 10:00 1.0 BREAK DOWNFISHINGTOOLS,REMOVED WEAR BUSHING.

10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH WITRI-CONE BIT TO CLEANOUT ANDCONDITIONE HOLEFORCASING,4'FILL.

15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATEDANDCONDITIONED HOLE FOR CASING.

17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETYMEETING. RIG UP WESTATESCASINGSERVICE. LAY DOWNDRILLPIPE.
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRIN6 Property: 055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETYMEETING. RU SCHLUMBERGER. LOGGINGWELL. LOGSRUN:PLATFORM EXPRESSWITH
DIPOLESONICFROM TD TO BASE OF INTCASING. ROTARY SIDEWALLCORES IN NEXTRUNS.

SAFETY MEETING: LOGGING

08-29-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FISHINGROTARY CORING TOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGW/SCHLUMBERGER. FINISHED RUNNINGPLATFORM EXPRESS& DIPOLE SONIC, LOGGERS TD
WASl1,706'.

07:00 09;00 2.0 WAITON ORDERS(CORE POINTS OFF OF LOGS). RECElVED CORE POINTSFROM GEOLOGY DEPT.

09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARY SIDEWALLCORETOOL, MADE ONE CORE@l1,653'AND WASSTUCK.

12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKEDTOOL, TRIED TO GET FREE WITHNO PROGRESS WHILE WAITINGON WEATHERFORD
FISHERMAN & TOOLS.

17:00 20:00 3.0 RUWEKTHERFORD TO STRIP OVER WIRELINE AND FISH TOOL. SAFETY MEETING:DON'T GET IN A
HURRY.

20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPING OVER WIRELINE, CAME LOOSE@4185'.

Ol:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINETOGETHER AND PULLED TOOL INTOOVERSHOT.

04:00 06:00 2,0 PULLED LINE OUT OF TOOL AND POHWlELECTRIC CABLE.

SAFETY MEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTEDCAROL DANIELS W/UOGM AT 10:30 AM, 8/26/04TO NOTIFYOF PRODUCTION CASING
CEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTEDDAN JARVIS (LEFT MESSAGE,NOAFTER-HOURS NUMBER)W/UTAH
DNRAT 11:30AM, 8-27-04 W/NOTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT,SLURRY & UPDATED TIMING
FOR PRODUCTION CEMENT JOB,

08-30-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 TOHWIDP, FISHING TOOLS & CORE TOOL(FISH). LD FISH.

09:00 10:00 1.0 BREAK DOWNFISHINGTOOLS,REMOVED WEAR BUSHING.

10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH WITRI-CONE BIT TO CLEANOUT ANDCONDITIONE HOLEFORCASING,4'FILL.

15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATEDANDCONDITIONED HOLE FOR CASING.

17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETYMEETING. RIG UP WESTATESCASINGSERVICE. LAY DOWNDRILLPIPE.
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRIN6 Property: 055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETYMEETING. RU SCHLUMBERGER. LOGGINGWELL. LOGSRUN:PLATFORM EXPRESSWITH
DIPOLESONICFROM TD TO BASE OF INTCASING. ROTARY SIDEWALLCORES IN NEXTRUNS.

SAFETY MEETING: LOGGING

08-29-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FISHINGROTARY CORING TOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGW/SCHLUMBERGER. FINISHED RUNNINGPLATFORM EXPRESS& DIPOLE SONIC, LOGGERS TD
WASl1,706'.

07:00 09;00 2.0 WAITON ORDERS(CORE POINTS OFF OF LOGS). RECElVED CORE POINTSFROM GEOLOGY DEPT.

09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARY SIDEWALLCORETOOL, MADE ONE CORE@l1,653'AND WASSTUCK.

12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKEDTOOL, TRIED TO GET FREE WITHNO PROGRESS WHILE WAITINGON WEATHERFORD
FISHERMAN & TOOLS.

17:00 20:00 3.0 RUWEKTHERFORD TO STRIP OVER WIRELINE AND FISH TOOL. SAFETY MEETING:DON'T GET IN A
HURRY.

20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPING OVER WIRELINE, CAME LOOSE@4185'.

Ol:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINETOGETHER AND PULLED TOOL INTOOVERSHOT.

04:00 06:00 2,0 PULLED LINE OUT OF TOOL AND POHWlELECTRIC CABLE.

SAFETY MEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTEDCAROL DANIELS W/UOGM AT 10:30 AM, 8/26/04TO NOTIFYOF PRODUCTION CASING
CEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTEDDAN JARVIS (LEFT MESSAGE,NOAFTER-HOURS NUMBER)W/UTAH
DNRAT 11:30AM, 8-27-04 W/NOTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT,SLURRY & UPDATED TIMING
FOR PRODUCTION CEMENT JOB,

08-30-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 TOHWIDP, FISHING TOOLS & CORE TOOL(FISH). LD FISH.

09:00 10:00 1.0 BREAK DOWNFISHINGTOOLS,REMOVED WEAR BUSHING.

10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH WITRI-CONE BIT TO CLEANOUT ANDCONDITIONE HOLEFORCASING,4'FILL.

15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATEDANDCONDITIONED HOLE FOR CASING.

17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETYMEETING. RIG UP WESTATESCASINGSERVICE. LAY DOWNDRILLPIPE.

Page



Well Namc: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

02:00 06:00 4.0 RUWESTATESCASINGTOOLS. SAFETY MEETING. RUN4 1/2", I1.6#, P-110, LTCCASINGAS FOLLOWS:
FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING,FLOAT COLLAR, CASING. CENTRALIZERSON MIDDLEFIRST JOINT, EVERY
OTHERJOINTTO 8800'(37 TOTAL). MARKERJOINTS@901l' AND6336'. (4100'OF CASINGPICKEDUP @
REPORT TIME).

SAFETYMEETING:LD DRILL PIPE

08-31-2004 Reported By AT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 .Days 19 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WOCOMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 FINISHED RUNNING TOTAL OF 293 JOINTS (291 FULL JTS + 2 - 20' MARKER JOINTS) OF 4 1/2", 11.6#, HC P-

110, LTCCASING. SHOE DEPTH l1,695', FLOAT COLLAR 11,652', 20' MARKERJTS 8989-9009' & 6334--6354'.

NO TIGHT SPOTS OR FILL. STRINGWEIGHT l 12,000# BEFORE CEMENTING.

09:00 11:00 2.0 CIRCULATED FOR CEMENT.

I I:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELLTO CEMENT. SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINESTO 5,000 PSI.
PUMP JOBAS FOLLOWS:20 BBLS MUD FLUSH, 20 BBLSH2OAHEAD, LEAD SLUR.RY; 713 SX (2182 CU/FT) G
HI LIFT, 3.05YLD, 11.5 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H2O, + 12% D020 +1% DO79+ .2% Dl67 + .2% DO46 + 2% D013 + .

25#/SK D029. TAIL SLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, 1.29 YLD, 14.1 PPG, 5.96 GAL/SK H2O, + 2%
D020 + .1% D046 + .1% D013 + .2% D167+ .2% DO65.DROPPED PLUGAND DISPLACED W/185.8BBL H2O.
MAX PRESSURE 2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUG TO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK .2 BBL, FLOATS HELD. RD
SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL.PU BOPAND SET SLIPSW/80,000LBS(NO BLOCK WEIGHT). EST TOP OF
CEMENT 4,000'.

TS:00
¯ ¯T8:00

3.0 CLEANED MUDTANKS.
18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVINGRIG TO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL COMPLETION

COMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.

DIESELTRANSFERREDTO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20: 3,000GALS@Sl.40/GAL
09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRACBLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10M BOPE. RU CUTTERS WL. RaN CBL/VDL/GR/CCL FROM PBTD TO 8000' & ACROSS CEMENT TOP @
3550'. RDWL. PRESSURETESTEDCASING,BOPE& FLOW EQUIPMENTTO 8500PSIG FOR 15MIN. SDFN.

09-04-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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Well Namc: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

02:00 06:00 4.0 RUWESTATESCASINGTOOLS. SAFETY MEETING. RUN4 1/2", I1.6#, P-110, LTCCASINGAS FOLLOWS:
FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING,FLOAT COLLAR, CASING. CENTRALIZERSON MIDDLEFIRST JOINT, EVERY
OTHERJOINTTO 8800'(37 TOTAL). MARKERJOINTS@901l' AND6336'. (4100'OF CASINGPICKEDUP @
REPORT TIME).

SAFETYMEETING:LD DRILL PIPE

08-31-2004 Reported By AT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 .Days 19 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WOCOMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 FINISHED RUNNING TOTAL OF 293 JOINTS (291 FULL JTS + 2 - 20' MARKER JOINTS) OF 4 1/2", 11.6#, HC P-

110, LTCCASING. SHOE DEPTH l1,695', FLOAT COLLAR 11,652', 20' MARKERJTS 8989-9009' & 6334--6354'.

NO TIGHT SPOTS OR FILL. STRINGWEIGHT l 12,000# BEFORE CEMENTING.

09:00 11:00 2.0 CIRCULATED FOR CEMENT.

I I:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELLTO CEMENT. SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINESTO 5,000 PSI.
PUMP JOBAS FOLLOWS:20 BBLS MUD FLUSH, 20 BBLSH2OAHEAD, LEAD SLUR.RY; 713 SX (2182 CU/FT) G
HI LIFT, 3.05YLD, 11.5 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H2O, + 12% D020 +1% DO79+ .2% Dl67 + .2% DO46 + 2% D013 + .

25#/SK D029. TAIL SLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, 1.29 YLD, 14.1 PPG, 5.96 GAL/SK H2O, + 2%
D020 + .1% D046 + .1% D013 + .2% D167+ .2% DO65.DROPPED PLUGAND DISPLACED W/185.8BBL H2O.
MAX PRESSURE 2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUG TO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK .2 BBL, FLOATS HELD. RD
SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL.PU BOPAND SET SLIPSW/80,000LBS(NO BLOCK WEIGHT). EST TOP OF
CEMENT 4,000'.

TS:00
¯ ¯T8:00

3.0 CLEANED MUDTANKS.
18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVINGRIG TO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL COMPLETION

COMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.

DIESELTRANSFERREDTO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20: 3,000GALS@Sl.40/GAL
09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRACBLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10M BOPE. RU CUTTERS WL. RaN CBL/VDL/GR/CCL FROM PBTD TO 8000' & ACROSS CEMENT TOP @
3550'. RDWL. PRESSURETESTEDCASING,BOPE& FLOW EQUIPMENTTO 8500PSIG FOR 15MIN. SDFN.

09-04-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

MD 11,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATED SUNNYSIDE FROM l l391'-93', 11406'-09', 11433'-34', 11462'-63', l l485'-87'
& 11503'-05' W/3-1/8" HSC PORTED CASINGGUNS@2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL

RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACDOWN CASING W/4959 GAL YFl25ST PAD, 45,381 GAL YFl25ST & YFI I SST &
168,556#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8348 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 6671 PSIG. ATR46.2 BPM. ISIP4200
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@11323'. PERFORATED BLACKHAWK FROM 11122'-25', 11153-

SS', 11229'-30', ll249'-50', 11274'-76' & 11289'-91'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRACDOWN CASINGW/4973 GALYF125ST PAD,58580 GALYF125ST & YFl18ST & 243,775#20/40 SAND@1-
6 PPG. MTP 8381 PSlG. MTR49.7 BPM. ATP 5671 PSIG. ATR 42.8 BPM. ISlP 5600PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED16HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIG. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED 1110 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.

09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion . Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion : Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD l1,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED920 BLW 1220 BLWTR.

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARING BETWEENFLUIDSLUGS. MINIMAL
CONDENSATE. RECOVERED790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRS ON 24/64 CHOKE. FCP l50 PSIG. EST 10-12 BPH. RECOVERED265 BLW 525 BLWTR. FLUID
COMMINGIN SLUGS NOT CONSTANT FLOW.

09-08-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

MD 11,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATED SUNNYSIDE FROM l l391'-93', 11406'-09', 11433'-34', 11462'-63', l l485'-87'
& 11503'-05' W/3-1/8" HSC PORTED CASINGGUNS@2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL

RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACDOWN CASING W/4959 GAL YFl25ST PAD, 45,381 GAL YFl25ST & YFI I SST &
168,556#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8348 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 6671 PSIG. ATR46.2 BPM. ISIP4200
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@11323'. PERFORATED BLACKHAWK FROM 11122'-25', 11153-

SS', 11229'-30', ll249'-50', 11274'-76' & 11289'-91'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRACDOWN CASINGW/4973 GALYF125ST PAD,58580 GALYF125ST & YFl18ST & 243,775#20/40 SAND@1-
6 PPG. MTP 8381 PSlG. MTR49.7 BPM. ATP 5671 PSIG. ATR 42.8 BPM. ISlP 5600PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED16HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIG. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED 1110 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.

09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion . Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion : Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD l1,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED920 BLW 1220 BLWTR.

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARING BETWEENFLUIDSLUGS. MINIMAL
CONDENSATE. RECOVERED790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRS ON 24/64 CHOKE. FCP l50 PSIG. EST 10-12 BPH. RECOVERED265 BLW 525 BLWTR. FLUID
COMMINGIN SLUGS NOT CONSTANT FLOW.

09-08-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

MD 11,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATED SUNNYSIDE FROM l l391'-93', 11406'-09', 11433'-34', 11462'-63', l l485'-87'
& 11503'-05' W/3-1/8" HSC PORTED CASINGGUNS@2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL

RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACDOWN CASING W/4959 GAL YFl25ST PAD, 45,381 GAL YFl25ST & YFI I SST &
168,556#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8348 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 6671 PSIG. ATR46.2 BPM. ISIP4200
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@11323'. PERFORATED BLACKHAWK FROM 11122'-25', 11153-

SS', 11229'-30', ll249'-50', 11274'-76' & 11289'-91'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRACDOWN CASINGW/4973 GALYF125ST PAD,58580 GALYF125ST & YFl18ST & 243,775#20/40 SAND@1-
6 PPG. MTP 8381 PSlG. MTR49.7 BPM. ATP 5671 PSIG. ATR 42.8 BPM. ISlP 5600PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED16HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIG. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED 1110 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.

09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion . Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion : Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD l1,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED920 BLW 1220 BLWTR.

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARING BETWEENFLUIDSLUGS. MINIMAL
CONDENSATE. RECOVERED790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRS ON 24/64 CHOKE. FCP l50 PSIG. EST 10-12 BPH. RECOVERED265 BLW 525 BLWTR. FLUID
COMMINGIN SLUGS NOT CONSTANT FLOW.

09-08-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRSON 24/64"CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED252 BLW 273 BLWTR.

MIRU DUCORIG#3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling I Completion Well Total

MD I1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE& BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANEDOUT & DRILLEDOUT PLUG@ l1,323'. RIH. FILL
@l1,469'. CLEANEDOUTTO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD i1,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0 0

Activity at Report Time: POH WITUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSlG, SICP 0 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS& WELLSTARTED FLOWING.
RECOVERED 44 BLW. FLOWED 4 HRS. ON 32/64"CHOKE& LOGGEDOFF. MADE 14 SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTEDFLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW. FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPEN CHOKE& LOGGEDOFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELL OPEN ON 16/64" CHOKE OVERNIGHT. 115BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MOVEIN FRACFLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FTP 0 PSIG, CP 1750 PSIG. CIRCULATED WELLWifREATEDWATER. POH. RU
COMPUTALOG WL. SET CIBP @l1,100'.

PERFORATED CASTLEGATE FROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32' & 11,065-66' W/3-

1/8" HSC PORTEDCASINGGUNS @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRSON 24/64"CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED252 BLW 273 BLWTR.

MIRU DUCORIG#3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling I Completion Well Total

MD I1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE& BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANEDOUT & DRILLEDOUT PLUG@ l1,323'. RIH. FILL

@l1,469'. CLEANEDOUTTO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD i1,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0 0

Activity at Report Time: POH WITUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSlG, SICP 0 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS& WELLSTARTED FLOWING.
RECOVERED 44 BLW. FLOWED 4 HRS. ON 32/64"CHOKE& LOGGEDOFF. MADE 14 SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTEDFLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW. FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPEN CHOKE& LOGGEDOFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELL OPEN ON 16/64" CHOKE OVERNIGHT. 115BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MOVEIN FRACFLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FTP 0 PSIG, CP 1750 PSIG. CIRCULATED WELLWifREATEDWATER. POH. RU
COMPUTALOG WL. SET CIBP @l1,100'.

PERFORATED CASTLEGATE FROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32' & 11,065-66' W/3-

1/8" HSC PORTEDCASINGGUNS @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRSON 24/64"CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED252 BLW 273 BLWTR.

MIRU DUCORIG#3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling I Completion Well Total

MD I1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE& BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANEDOUT & DRILLEDOUT PLUG@ l1,323'. RIH. FILL

@l1,469'. CLEANEDOUTTO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD i1,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0 0

Activity at Report Time: POH WITUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSlG, SICP 0 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS& WELLSTARTED FLOWING.
RECOVERED 44 BLW. FLOWED 4 HRS. ON 32/64"CHOKE& LOGGEDOFF. MADE 14 SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTEDFLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW. FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPEN CHOKE& LOGGEDOFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELL OPEN ON 16/64" CHOKE OVERNIGHT. 115BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MOVEIN FRACFLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FTP 0 PSIG, CP 1750 PSIG. CIRCULATED WELLWifREATEDWATER. POH. RU
COMPUTALOG WL. SET CIBP @l1,100'.

PERFORATED CASTLEGATE FROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32' & 11,065-66' W/3-

1/8" HSC PORTEDCASINGGUNS @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERPARE FORFRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 PREP TO FRAC.

09-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10635-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLUE CASTLEZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRAC CASTLEGATE DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALYF125ST PAD, 53,760 GALSYF125ST
& YF118ST & 212,500#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. SCREENED OUT WI40 BBLS FLUSH REMAINING.206,300#
SAND IN FORMATION. MTP 8588 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP6933 PSIG. ATR 44.2 BPM. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
FLOWED 3.5 HRSTHROUGH10/64"& 24/64" CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED 289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR.
SLIGHT SAND.

RUWL. PERFORATED NELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52' @
2 SPF & 180° PHASING, SETCOMPOSITEFRAC PLUG @10,882'. RDWL RU SCHLUMBERGER PUMPS.
FRACED DOWN CASING W/5000 GALSYF125STPAD,49,518 GALSYFl25ST & YFll8ST & 193,000#20/40
SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8555PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP 7546 PSIG. ATR 37 BPM. ISIP 4625 PSIG. SDFN.

09-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3700 PSIG. RUWL. SET WEATHERFORD COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,359'. PERFED BLUE CASTLE
FROM 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14' & 10,323-25'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED DOWN CASING W/5000 GALSYFI2ST PAD, 38,430 GALSYF125ST & YF118ST
& 139,100# 20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 7712 PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP 6218 PSIG. ATR 43 BPM. ISIP 4370
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,225'. UNABLE TO GET OFF PLUG. PULLEDOUTOF ROPE
SOCKET. RDWL. (FISH CONSISTSOF 1-7/16" CABLE HEAD,3-1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR, 3-1/8" QUICK
CHANGE, 19'X 3-1/8" CASINGGUN, SETTINGTOOLADAPTER, FIRING HEAD, SETTINGTOOL & SETTING
SLEEVE. OVER ALL LENGTH 32.5'). RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 14.25 HRSON 10/64"TO 24/64" CHOKE. AT 5 AM, 24/64" CHOKE,FCP 400 PSIG, 55-60 BFPH.
RECOVERED 903 BLW. 2996 BLWTR.

09-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation :. MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-! 1066 PKR Depth : 0.0
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERPARE FORFRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 PREP TO FRAC.

09-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10635-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLUE CASTLEZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRAC CASTLEGATE DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALYF125ST PAD, 53,760 GALSYF125ST
& YF118ST & 212,500#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. SCREENED OUT WI40 BBLS FLUSH REMAINING.206,300#
SAND IN FORMATION. MTP 8588 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP6933 PSIG. ATR 44.2 BPM. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
FLOWED 3.5 HRSTHROUGH10/64"& 24/64" CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED 289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR.
SLIGHT SAND.

RUWL. PERFORATED NELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52' @
2 SPF & 180° PHASING, SETCOMPOSITEFRAC PLUG @10,882'. RDWL RU SCHLUMBERGER PUMPS.
FRACED DOWN CASING W/5000 GALSYF125STPAD,49,518 GALSYFl25ST & YFll8ST & 193,000#20/40
SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8555PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP 7546 PSIG. ATR 37 BPM. ISIP 4625 PSIG. SDFN.

09-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3700 PSIG. RUWL. SET WEATHERFORD COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,359'. PERFED BLUE CASTLE
FROM 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14' & 10,323-25'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED DOWN CASING W/5000 GALSYFI2ST PAD, 38,430 GALSYF125ST & YF118ST
& 139,100# 20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 7712 PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP 6218 PSIG. ATR 43 BPM. ISIP 4370
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,225'. UNABLE TO GET OFF PLUG. PULLEDOUTOF ROPE
SOCKET. RDWL. (FISH CONSISTSOF 1-7/16" CABLE HEAD,3-1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR, 3-1/8" QUICK
CHANGE, 19'X 3-1/8" CASINGGUN, SETTINGTOOLADAPTER, FIRING HEAD, SETTINGTOOL & SETTING
SLEEVE. OVER ALL LENGTH 32.5'). RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 14.25 HRSON 10/64"TO 24/64" CHOKE. AT 5 AM, 24/64" CHOKE,FCP 400 PSIG, 55-60 BFPH.
RECOVERED 903 BLW. 2996 BLWTR.

09-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation :. MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-! 1066 PKR Depth : 0.0
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERPARE FORFRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 PREP TO FRAC.

09-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10635-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLUE CASTLEZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRAC CASTLEGATE DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALYF125ST PAD, 53,760 GALSYF125ST
& YF118ST & 212,500#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. SCREENED OUT WI40 BBLS FLUSH REMAINING.206,300#
SAND IN FORMATION. MTP 8588 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP6933 PSIG. ATR 44.2 BPM. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
FLOWED 3.5 HRSTHROUGH10/64"& 24/64" CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED 289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR.
SLIGHT SAND.

RUWL. PERFORATED NELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52' @
2 SPF & 180° PHASING, SETCOMPOSITEFRAC PLUG @10,882'. RDWL RU SCHLUMBERGER PUMPS.
FRACED DOWN CASING W/5000 GALSYF125STPAD,49,518 GALSYFl25ST & YFll8ST & 193,000#20/40
SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8555PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP 7546 PSIG. ATR 37 BPM. ISIP 4625 PSIG. SDFN.

09-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3700 PSIG. RUWL. SET WEATHERFORD COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,359'. PERFED BLUE CASTLE
FROM 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14' & 10,323-25'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED DOWN CASING W/5000 GALSYFI2ST PAD, 38,430 GALSYF125ST & YF118ST
& 139,100# 20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 7712 PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP 6218 PSIG. ATR 43 BPM. ISIP 4370
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,225'. UNABLE TO GET OFF PLUG. PULLEDOUTOF ROPE
SOCKET. RDWL. (FISH CONSISTSOF 1-7/16" CABLE HEAD,3-1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR, 3-1/8" QUICK
CHANGE, 19'X 3-1/8" CASINGGUN, SETTINGTOOLADAPTER, FIRING HEAD, SETTINGTOOL & SETTING
SLEEVE. OVER ALL LENGTH 32.5'). RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 14.25 HRSON 10/64"TO 24/64" CHOKE. AT 5 AM, 24/64" CHOKE,FCP 400 PSIG, 55-60 BFPH.
RECOVERED 903 BLW. 2996 BLWTR.

09-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation :. MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-! 1066 PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRIN6 Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILL FRAC PLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 4 HRS ON 32/64" CHOKE. FCP 100PSIG. 1F12 BFPH. RECOVERED 48 BLW. 2948 BLWTR. KILLED
WELL W/75 BBLSTREATEDWATER. RIH W/OVERSHOT, JARS & BUMPERSUBTO 10,210'. CIRCULATEDTO
TOPOF FISH@10,225'. LATCHED ONTO FISH. WORKEDFISHFREE. POH. LAYED DOWNFISH& FISHING
TOOLS. RIHWl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUBTO 9985'. SDFN.

09-17-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 33 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERFUPPERBLUECASTLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 1900 PSIG. SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEWWELLDOWN. KILLED TUBING W/25 BBLSTREATED WATER. RIH
TOBP @10,225'. POH TO 9993'. DISPLACEDHOLEW/TREATEDWATER. PRESSURE TESTED BP TO 4000
PSIG. POH. SDFN.

09 18-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I 1652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SLWOFRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

09:00 12:30 3,5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RU CUTTERS WL. PERFORATEDBLUECASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',
10,178-80', 10185-88' & 10,193-95'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL SI. WO FRAC.

09-21-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI.WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURINGRIG UP SCHLUMBERGER HAD EQUIPMENTFAILURE. SI. WO FRACEQUIPMENT

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-!1066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACBLUE CASTLE DOWN CASINGWl4946 GALSYFl25ST PAD,
40,903 GALSYF125ST & YF118ST & 145,800#20/40 SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6184 PSlG. ATR 42.4 BPM. ISIP 3875 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.LEFT FRAC HEAD ON BOPs. BLIND RAMS
WOULDNOT FULLY CLOSE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRIN6 Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILL FRAC PLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 4 HRS ON 32/64" CHOKE. FCP 100PSIG. 1F12 BFPH. RECOVERED 48 BLW. 2948 BLWTR. KILLED
WELL W/75 BBLSTREATEDWATER. RIH W/OVERSHOT, JARS & BUMPERSUBTO 10,210'. CIRCULATEDTO
TOPOF FISH@10,225'. LATCHED ONTO FISH. WORKEDFISHFREE. POH. LAYED DOWNFISH& FISHING
TOOLS. RIHWl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUBTO 9985'. SDFN.

09-17-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 33 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERFUPPERBLUECASTLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 1900 PSIG. SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEWWELLDOWN. KILLED TUBING W/25 BBLSTREATED WATER. RIH
TOBP @10,225'. POH TO 9993'. DISPLACEDHOLEW/TREATEDWATER. PRESSURE TESTED BP TO 4000
PSIG. POH. SDFN.

09 18-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I 1652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SLWOFRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

09:00 12:30 3,5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RU CUTTERS WL. PERFORATEDBLUECASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',
10,178-80', 10185-88' & 10,193-95'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL SI. WO FRAC.

09-21-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI.WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURINGRIG UP SCHLUMBERGER HAD EQUIPMENTFAILURE. SI. WO FRACEQUIPMENT

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-!1066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACBLUE CASTLE DOWN CASINGWl4946 GALSYFl25ST PAD,
40,903 GALSYF125ST & YF118ST & 145,800#20/40 SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6184 PSlG. ATR 42.4 BPM. ISIP 3875 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.LEFT FRAC HEAD ON BOPs. BLIND RAMS
WOULDNOT FULLY CLOSE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRIN6 Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILL FRAC PLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 4 HRS ON 32/64" CHOKE. FCP 100PSIG. 1F12 BFPH. RECOVERED 48 BLW. 2948 BLWTR. KILLED
WELL W/75 BBLSTREATEDWATER. RIH W/OVERSHOT, JARS & BUMPERSUBTO 10,210'. CIRCULATEDTO
TOPOF FISH@10,225'. LATCHED ONTO FISH. WORKEDFISHFREE. POH. LAYED DOWNFISH& FISHING
TOOLS. RIHWl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUBTO 9985'. SDFN.

09-17-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 33 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERFUPPERBLUECASTLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 1900 PSIG. SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEWWELLDOWN. KILLED TUBING W/25 BBLSTREATED WATER. RIH
TOBP @10,225'. POH TO 9993'. DISPLACEDHOLEW/TREATEDWATER. PRESSURE TESTED BP TO 4000
PSIG. POH. SDFN.

09 18-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I 1652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SLWOFRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

09:00 12:30 3,5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RU CUTTERS WL. PERFORATEDBLUECASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',
10,178-80', 10185-88' & 10,193-95'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL SI. WO FRAC.

09-21-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI.WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURINGRIG UP SCHLUMBERGER HAD EQUIPMENTFAILURE. SI. WO FRACEQUIPMENT

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-!1066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACBLUE CASTLE DOWN CASINGWl4946 GALSYFl25ST PAD,
40,903 GALSYF125ST & YF118ST & 145,800#20/40 SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6184 PSlG. ATR 42.4 BPM. ISIP 3875 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.LEFT FRAC HEAD ON BOPs. BLIND RAMS
WOULDNOT FULLY CLOSE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRIN15 Property:055517

FLOWED WELL 21 HRS ON 32/64" CHOKE. FCP450 PSIG. 20 BFPH. RECOVERED 712 BLW. 3495 BLWTR.

09-24-2004 ReporteAH HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion We11Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 37 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 2 HRSONAN OPENCHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. PUMPED 85 BBLS TREATEDWATERDOWNCASING. RIH
W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB. CLEANED OUT & DRILLEDOUT PLUGS @10,225', 10,359' & 10,882'. RIH.
CLEANED OUT TO CIBP @11,100'. LANDEDTUBING@11,061'KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPEDBALL &
PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.

FLOWED10 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 500 PSIG. CP 500 PSIG. 5-7 BFPH. RECOVERED 180 BLW. 3762
BLWTR.

TUBINGDETAIL : LENGTH

PUMPOFFASSEMBLY .91'

1 JT 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 EUE TUBING 32.61'

XN NIPPLE 125'

337 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 TUBING l 1,012.35'

BELOWKB 14.00'

LANDED AT 11,061.12'KB

09-25-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 38 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RDMOSU.

FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1125 PSIG. l-3 BFPH. RECOVERED69 BLW. 3513 BLWTR.

09-26-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion Well Total

MD I 1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 39 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1000 PSIG. 1 BFPH. RECOVERED 75 BLW. 3438 BLWTR.

06:00
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRIN15 Property:055517

FLOWED WELL 21 HRS ON 32/64" CHOKE. FCP450 PSIG. 20 BFPH. RECOVERED 712 BLW. 3495 BLWTR.

09-24-2004 ReporteAH HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion We11Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 37 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 2 HRSONAN OPENCHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. PUMPED 85 BBLS TREATEDWATERDOWNCASING. RIH
W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB. CLEANED OUT & DRILLEDOUT PLUGS @10,225', 10,359' & 10,882'. RIH.
CLEANED OUT TO CIBP @11,100'. LANDEDTUBING@11,061'KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPEDBALL &
PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.

FLOWED10 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 500 PSIG. CP 500 PSIG. 5-7 BFPH. RECOVERED 180 BLW. 3762
BLWTR.

TUBINGDETAIL : LENGTH

PUMPOFFASSEMBLY .91'

1 JT 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 EUE TUBING 32.61'

XN NIPPLE 125'

337 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 TUBING l 1,012.35'

BELOWKB 14.00'

LANDED AT 11,061.12'KB

09-25-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 38 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RDMOSU.

FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1125 PSIG. l-3 BFPH. RECOVERED69 BLW. 3513 BLWTR.

09-26-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion Well Total

MD I 1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 39 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1000 PSIG. 1 BFPH. RECOVERED 75 BLW. 3438 BLWTR.

06:00
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRIN15 Property:055517

FLOWED WELL 21 HRS ON 32/64" CHOKE. FCP450 PSIG. 20 BFPH. RECOVERED 712 BLW. 3495 BLWTR.

09-24-2004 ReporteAH HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion We11Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 37 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 2 HRSONAN OPENCHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. PUMPED 85 BBLS TREATEDWATERDOWNCASING. RIH
W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB. CLEANED OUT & DRILLEDOUT PLUGS @10,225', 10,359' & 10,882'. RIH.
CLEANED OUT TO CIBP @11,100'. LANDEDTUBING@11,061'KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPEDBALL &
PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.

FLOWED10 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 500 PSIG. CP 500 PSIG. 5-7 BFPH. RECOVERED 180 BLW. 3762
BLWTR.

TUBINGDETAIL : LENGTH

PUMPOFFASSEMBLY .91'

1 JT 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 EUE TUBING 32.61'

XN NIPPLE 125'

337 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 TUBING l 1,012.35'

BELOWKB 14.00'

LANDED AT 11,061.12'KB

09-25-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 38 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RDMOSU.

FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1125 PSIG. l-3 BFPH. RECOVERED69 BLW. 3513 BLWTR.

09-26-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ' Completion Well Total

MD I 1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 39 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1000 PSIG. 1 BFPH. RECOVERED 75 BLW. 3438 BLWTR.

06:00
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

09-27-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD t 1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 40 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 400 PSIG. CP 1050 PSIG. 1-2 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.
RECOVERED75 BLW. 3363 BLWTR.

09-28-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling . Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total $

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 41 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 800 PSIG. CP 1450 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED 60 BLW. 3303 BLWTR.

09-29-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total ^

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI - WOFURTHER ACTIVITY

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 12:00 6.0 FLOWED 6 HRS ON 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 750 PSIG. CP 1500 PSIG. 3-5 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED24 BLW. 3279 BLWTR. SI.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

09-27-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD t 1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 40 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 400 PSIG. CP 1050 PSIG. 1-2 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.
RECOVERED75 BLW. 3363 BLWTR.

09-28-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling . Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total $

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 41 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 800 PSIG. CP 1450 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED 60 BLW. 3303 BLWTR.

09-29-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
^

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI - WOFURTHER ACTIVITY

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 12:00 6.0 FLOWED 6 HRS ON 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 750 PSIG. CP 1500 PSIG. 3-5 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED24 BLW. 3279 BLWTR. SI.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

09-27-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD t 1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 40 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 400 PSIG. CP 1050 PSIG. 1-2 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.
RECOVERED75 BLW. 3363 BLWTR.

09-28-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling . Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total $

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 41 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 800 PSIG. CP 1450 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED 60 BLW. 3303 BLWTR.

09-29-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
^

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI - WOFURTHER ACTIVITY

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 12:00 6.0 FLOWED 6 HRS ON 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 750 PSIG. CP 1500 PSIG. 3-5 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED24 BLW. 3279 BLWTR. SI.
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STATE OF UTAH L. FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER;

UT ST ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STATE 1-32
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR; 9. API NUMBER

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4304735839
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX250 e im BIG PINEY s,,,, W y,, 83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL - 2067' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN; SENW 32 10S 18E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT 3FF
Data ofwoi completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: DRILLING
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPERATIONS

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Please see the attached well chronology report for drillingoperations from 8/07/2004 - 11/02/2004.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Kaylene R. Gardner TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE Af A d A DATE 11/2/2004

(ThisspaceforStateuseon* RECENE

NOyO4 2004

(6/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side) DN.OFOLGAS&M\N\N

STATE OF UTAH L. FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER;

UT ST ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STATE 1-32
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR; 9. API NUMBER

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4304735839
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX250 e im BIG PINEY s,,,, W y,, 83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT
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FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL - 2067' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN; SENW 32 10S 18E STATE:
UTAH
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(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT 3FF
Data ofwoi completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: DRILLING
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPERATIONS

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Please see the attached well chronology report for drillingoperations from 8/07/2004 - 11/02/2004.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Kaylene R. Gardner TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE Af A d A DATE 11/2/2004

(ThisspaceforStateuseon* RECENE

NOyO4 2004

(6/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side) DN.OFOLGAS&M\N\N

STATE OF UTAH L. FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER;

UT ST ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do not use this form for proposals to drillnew wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
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FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL - 2067' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN; SENW 32 10S 18E STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGETUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT 3FF
Data ofwoi completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: DRILLING
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPERATIONS

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Please see the attached well chronology report for drillingoperations from 8/07/2004 - 11/02/2004.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Kaylene R. Gardner TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE Af A d A DATE 11/2/2004

(ThisspaceforStateuseon* RECENE

NOyO4 2004

(6/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side) DN.OFOLGAS&M\N\N



WELL CHRONOLOGY

eog res omtrees REPORT

emmonwe fem Report Generated On: 11-02-2004

Well Name STATE01-32 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIGSPRING API # 43-047-35839 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/ 5,571

Location Section32,T10S,RISE, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOGRESOURCES, INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total DHC / CWC

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE#9 Start Date 07-23-2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATIONDATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONDATA

2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW)

SECTION 32, T10S, R18E

UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH

TD: 11,700'BLACKHAWK

TRUERIG#9
WC/GAS
BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST MI.-48380

ELEVATION: 5572'NATGL, 557]' PREPGL, 5585'KB (14')

EOGWI 50%, NRI 43.75%

DOMINIONEXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIE TROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling , . . Completiom Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completi- Well Total

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :

WELL CHRONOLOGY

eog res omtrees REPORT

emmonwe fem Report Generated On: 11-02-2004

Well Name STATE01-32 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIGSPRING API # 43-047-35839 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/ 5,571

Location Section32,T10S,RISE, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOGRESOURCES, INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total DHC / CWC

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE#9 Start Date 07-23-2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATIONDATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONDATA

2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW)

SECTION 32, T10S, R18E

UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH

TD: 11,700'BLACKHAWK

TRUERIG#9
WC/GAS
BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST MI.-48380

ELEVATION: 5572'NATGL, 557]' PREPGL, 5585'KB (14')

EOGWI 50%, NRI 43.75%

DOMINIONEXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIE TROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling , . . Completiom Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completi- Well Total

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :

WELL CHRONOLOGY

eog res omtrees REPORT

emmonwe fem Report Generated On: 11-02-2004

Well Name STATE01-32 Well Type EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIGSPRING API # 43-047-35839 Well Class COMP

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/ 5,571

Location Section32,T10S,RISE, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOGRESOURCES, INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total DHC / CWC

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE#9 Start Date 07-23-2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATIONDATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONDATA

2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW)

SECTION 32, T10S, R18E

UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH

TD: 11,700'BLACKHAWK

TRUERIG#9
WC/GAS
BIG SPRINGPROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST MI.-48380

ELEVATION: 5572'NATGL, 557]' PREPGL, 5585'KB (14')

EOGWI 50%, NRI 43.75%

DOMINIONEXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIE TROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling , . . Completiom Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completi- Well Total

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :



WellName: STATE01-32 Field BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17½ "HOLE @ 3:00 PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED17 1/2"HOLETO 230'. RAN5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#lFT, H-40, ST&C CASING& LANDED @
238.90' KB. RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. PRESSURE TESTED LINES AND CEMENT VALVETO 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED20 BBLSGELLEDWATER& 20 BBLSWATERFLUSHAHEADOF CEMENT. MIXED& PUMPED225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENTW/2%CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXEDCEMENT@15.8 PPGW/YIELDOF 1.15
CF/SX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT Wl29 BBLSWATER & SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE. HAD 12 BBLS
CEMENT RETURNS TO SURFACE. RD BlG 4. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARYRIG. WORT. WILL DROP
FROMREPORTUNTILFURTHERACTIVITY.

EDTROTTERNOTIFIEDCAROLDANIELSW/UOGMOF SPUDDINGWELLAT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD I,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRU TRUE RIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER,HCR AND HOOK UP CHOKELINES.
13:30 14:30 l.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHP51 BIT,5/6 LOBE 4 STAGE MOTOR, SHOCK SUB AND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT 214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30 00 DRILLROTATE229' TO 285' (56') 56'/HR. 18/20K WOB, ÑS BIT RPM.
16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 285' TO 350' (65') 65'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.
18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588'(238') 47.6'/HR. 22/25K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY@503', 3/4 DEG.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL ROTATE 588' TO 1005' (417') 69.5'/HR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIG ON DAY WORK 10:00 AM, 8/12/04
NOTIFIED UTAM DNR (CARROLDANIELS)OF INTENTTO SPUD @08:30 8/12/04

FUEL AT START OF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETY MEETING: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNINGSLICKLINESURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7--7/8"HOLEAT 3:30 PM, 8/12/04
08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING
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WellName: STATE01-32 Field BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17½ "HOLE @ 3:00 PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED17 1/2"HOLETO 230'. RAN5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#lFT, H-40, ST&C CASING& LANDED @
238.90' KB. RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. PRESSURE TESTED LINES AND CEMENT VALVETO 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED20 BBLSGELLEDWATER& 20 BBLSWATERFLUSHAHEADOF CEMENT. MIXED& PUMPED225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENTW/2%CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXEDCEMENT@15.8 PPGW/YIELDOF 1.15
CF/SX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT Wl29 BBLSWATER & SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE. HAD 12 BBLS
CEMENT RETURNS TO SURFACE. RD BlG 4. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARYRIG. WORT. WILL DROP
FROMREPORTUNTILFURTHERACTIVITY.

EDTROTTERNOTIFIEDCAROLDANIELSW/UOGMOF SPUDDINGWELLAT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD I,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRU TRUE RIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER,HCR AND HOOK UP CHOKELINES.
13:30 14:30 l.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHP51 BIT,5/6 LOBE 4 STAGE MOTOR, SHOCK SUB AND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT 214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30 00 DRILLROTATE229' TO 285' (56') 56'/HR. 18/20K WOB, ÑS BIT RPM.
16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 285' TO 350' (65') 65'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.
18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588'(238') 47.6'/HR. 22/25K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY@503', 3/4 DEG.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL ROTATE 588' TO 1005' (417') 69.5'/HR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIG ON DAY WORK 10:00 AM, 8/12/04
NOTIFIED UTAM DNR (CARROLDANIELS)OF INTENTTO SPUD @08:30 8/12/04

FUEL AT START OF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETY MEETING: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNINGSLICKLINESURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7--7/8"HOLEAT 3:30 PM, 8/12/04
08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING
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WellName: STATE01-32 Field BIG SPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17½ "HOLE @ 3:00 PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED17 1/2"HOLETO 230'. RAN5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#lFT, H-40, ST&C CASING& LANDED @
238.90' KB. RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. PRESSURE TESTED LINES AND CEMENT VALVETO 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED20 BBLSGELLEDWATER& 20 BBLSWATERFLUSHAHEADOF CEMENT. MIXED& PUMPED225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENTW/2%CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXEDCEMENT@15.8 PPGW/YIELDOF 1.15
CF/SX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT Wl29 BBLSWATER & SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE. HAD 12 BBLS
CEMENT RETURNS TO SURFACE. RD BlG 4. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARYRIG. WORT. WILL DROP
FROMREPORTUNTILFURTHERACTIVITY.

EDTROTTERNOTIFIEDCAROLDANIELSW/UOGMOF SPUDDINGWELLAT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD I,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRU TRUE RIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER,HCR AND HOOK UP CHOKELINES.
13:30 14:30 l.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHP51 BIT,5/6 LOBE 4 STAGE MOTOR, SHOCK SUB AND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT 214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30 00 DRILLROTATE229' TO 285' (56') 56'/HR. 18/20K WOB, ÑS BIT RPM.
16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 285' TO 350' (65') 65'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.
18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588'(238') 47.6'/HR. 22/25K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY@503', 3/4 DEG.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL ROTATE 588' TO 1005' (417') 69.5'/HR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIG ON DAY WORK 10:00 AM, 8/12/04
NOTIFIED UTAM DNR (CARROLDANIELS)OF INTENTTO SPUD @08:30 8/12/04

FUEL AT START OF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETY MEETING: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNINGSLICKLINESURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7--7/8"HOLEAT 3:30 PM, 8/12/04
08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Page



WellName: STATE 01-32 Fiehi: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL & RŒATE 1005'TO 1117'(ll2') 74.6'/HR, 38/40K WOB, 155 RPM,

07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY@1048', 3/4 DEG.
08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE1117' TO 1365' (248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45K WOB, 127RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE 1365' TO 1610'(245') 61.2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540',2 1/2DEG.
15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL& ROTATE 16l0' TO l927' (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @1843',2 3/4 DEG.
22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL & RŒATE 1927' TO 2260'(333') 44.4'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: REPAIR PUMP/WORKING WITH NEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY
TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS
BGG--72, CCr378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ---.. Completion Well Total

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHORTTRIPPRIORTO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06;00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & RŒATE 2260' TO 2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @2300', l 1/4DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.5'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

I I:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2457' TO 2865'(408') 45.3'lHR, 48/52KWOB,45/82RPM.
20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY@2780', 2 DEG.
20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 2865' TO 3200'(335') 44.6'/HR, 48/52KWOB,45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSING WATER AT ±3000',

LOST TUTALOF 640BBLSEST.
04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3113', I DEG.
04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIPTO DRILLCOLLARS. HOLETAKING2 TIMESNORMAL FILL.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNINGFORKLIFT,WIRELINESURVEYS
TEMP52 DEG

FORMATION:GREENRIVER20%SH, 35% SS, 45% LS
BGG 34, CG 43

08-16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Fiehi: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL & RŒATE 1005'TO 1117'(ll2') 74.6'/HR, 38/40K WOB, 155 RPM,

07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY@1048', 3/4 DEG.
08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE1117' TO 1365' (248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45K WOB, 127RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE 1365' TO 1610'(245') 61.2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540',2 1/2DEG.
15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL& ROTATE 16l0' TO l927' (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @1843',2 3/4 DEG.
22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL & RŒATE 1927' TO 2260'(333') 44.4'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: REPAIR PUMP/WORKING WITH NEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY
TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS

BGG--72, CCr378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ---.. Completion Well Total

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHORTTRIPPRIORTO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06;00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & RŒATE 2260' TO 2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @2300', l 1/4DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.5'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

I I:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2457' TO 2865'(408') 45.3'lHR, 48/52KWOB,45/82RPM.
20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY@2780', 2 DEG.
20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 2865' TO 3200'(335') 44.6'/HR, 48/52KWOB,45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSING WATER AT ±3000',

LOST TUTALOF 640BBLSEST.
04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3113', I DEG.
04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIPTO DRILLCOLLARS. HOLETAKING2 TIMESNORMAL FILL.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNINGFORKLIFT,WIRELINESURVEYS
TEMP52 DEG

FORMATION:GREENRIVER20%SH, 35% SS, 45% LS
BGG 34, CG 43

08-16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Page

WellName: STATE 01-32 Fiehi: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL & RŒATE 1005'TO 1117'(ll2') 74.6'/HR, 38/40K WOB, 155 RPM,

07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY@1048', 3/4 DEG.
08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE1117' TO 1365' (248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45K WOB, 127RPM.
10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

11:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE 1365' TO 1610'(245') 61.2'/HR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @1540',2 1/2DEG.
15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL& ROTATE 16l0' TO l927' (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @1843',2 3/4 DEG.
22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL & RŒATE 1927' TO 2260'(333') 44.4'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: REPAIR PUMP/WORKING WITH NEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY
TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS

BGG--72, CCr378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling ---.. Completion Well Total

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHORTTRIPPRIORTO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06;00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & RŒATE 2260' TO 2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @2300', l 1/4DEG.
08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL& ROTATE2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.5'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

I I:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2457' TO 2865'(408') 45.3'lHR, 48/52KWOB,45/82RPM.
20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY@2780', 2 DEG.
20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 2865' TO 3200'(335') 44.6'/HR, 48/52KWOB,45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSING WATER AT ±3000',

LOST TUTALOF 640BBLSEST.
04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY@3113', I DEG.
04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMSUP WITH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIPTO DRILLCOLLARS. HOLETAKING2 TIMESNORMAL FILL.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNINGFORKLIFT,WIRELINESURVEYS
TEMP52 DEG

FORMATION:GREENRIVER20%SH, 35% SS, 45% LS
BGG 34, CG 43

08-16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Page



WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: NDDIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE, NO FILL,NO DRAG.
07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL& ROTATE3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATEDBOTTOMSUP,CHANGEOF SCOPE. DRILLADDITIONAL89' DUETO DRILL BREAKS.
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE.CHANGEOF SCOPE,DRILADDITIONAL86'.
12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'lHR, 48/50KWOB,45/82 RPM.
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDDIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'IHR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM,

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATE BUTTOMSUP. SPOT75 BBLS LCMPILLON BOTTOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLETO RUN CASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWNMACHINE. LAlD DOWN3 - 8" COLLARS,MOTOR AND SHOCKSUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELDPRE-JOB SAFETYMEETING. RIG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASINGAS FOLLOWS: GUIDE SHOE, 1 FLOAT
JOINT, FLOATCOLLAR,76JTS CASING. RANTOTALOF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASING SHOE
LANDED AT 3400', FLOAT COLLARAT 3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS5' ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,
THEN EVERYSTHJT. TACKWELDED SHOE & TOP AND BUTTOM OF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLEDPLUGRETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCHTO SCHLUMBERGER,LEADW/285SXS "G"WITH 5% D44, 12% D20, 1% D79, .25% Dl12, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0 PPG,YIELD 3.91.TAIL WITH320 SXS "G"W/10% DS3,2% Sl, .25 PPS D29, MIXED AT
14.2 PPGYlELD l.61. DROPPED PLUG AND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLSWATER, DID NOT BUMPPLUG, HAD
FULLRETURNSTHROUGHOUTJOB WITH 50 BBLSCEMENT TO SURFACE. RELEASE PSI, FLOAT EQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER, SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSGWITH98K STRINGWT.
04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUEND DIVERTERAND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETYMEETING:OIL SPILLSAND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NOTIFIED UTAH DOG&M OF INTENT TO SET AND CEMENTINTERMEDIATECASING(LEFTCAROL
DANIELSA MESSAGE)AT09:30AM, 8/15/04
RECIEVED73 JTS 9 5/8" CASINGFROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TOTAL PIPE ON LOCATION
3451'

FORMATION:GREENRIVER35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKEFINALCUTON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOGWITH SCHLUMBERGERWHILENU BOP'S.
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: NDDIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE, NO FILL,NO DRAG.
07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL& ROTATE3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATEDBOTTOMSUP,CHANGEOF SCOPE. DRILLADDITIONAL89' DUETO DRILL BREAKS.
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE.CHANGEOF SCOPE,DRILADDITIONAL86'.
12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'lHR, 48/50KWOB,45/82 RPM.
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDDIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'IHR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM,

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATE BUTTOMSUP. SPOT75 BBLS LCMPILLON BOTTOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLETO RUN CASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWNMACHINE. LAlD DOWN3 - 8" COLLARS,MOTOR AND SHOCKSUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELDPRE-JOB SAFETYMEETING. RIG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASINGAS FOLLOWS: GUIDE SHOE, 1 FLOAT
JOINT, FLOATCOLLAR,76JTS CASING. RANTOTALOF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASING SHOE
LANDED AT 3400', FLOAT COLLARAT 3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS5' ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,
THEN EVERYSTHJT. TACKWELDED SHOE & TOP AND BUTTOM OF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLEDPLUGRETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCHTO SCHLUMBERGER,LEADW/285SXS "G"WITH 5% D44, 12% D20, 1% D79, .25% Dl12, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0 PPG,YIELD 3.91.TAIL WITH320 SXS "G"W/10% DS3,2% Sl, .25 PPS D29, MIXED AT
14.2 PPGYlELD l.61. DROPPED PLUG AND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLSWATER, DID NOT BUMPPLUG, HAD
FULLRETURNSTHROUGHOUTJOB WITH 50 BBLSCEMENT TO SURFACE. RELEASE PSI, FLOAT EQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER, SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSGWITH98K STRINGWT.
04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUEND DIVERTERAND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETYMEETING:OIL SPILLSAND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NOTIFIED UTAH DOG&M OF INTENT TO SET AND CEMENTINTERMEDIATECASING(LEFTCAROL
DANIELSA MESSAGE)AT09:30AM, 8/15/04
RECIEVED73 JTS 9 5/8" CASINGFROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TOTAL PIPE ON LOCATION
3451'

FORMATION:GREENRIVER35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKEFINALCUTON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOGWITH SCHLUMBERGERWHILENU BOP'S.
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: NDDIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE, NO FILL,NO DRAG.
07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL& ROTATE3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATEDBOTTOMSUP,CHANGEOF SCOPE. DRILLADDITIONAL89' DUETO DRILL BREAKS.
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3225' TO 3314' (89') 25.4'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE.CHANGEOF SCOPE,DRILADDITIONAL86'.
12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'lHR, 48/50KWOB,45/82 RPM.
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDDIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'IHR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM,

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATE BUTTOMSUP. SPOT75 BBLS LCMPILLON BOTTOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLETO RUN CASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWNMACHINE. LAlD DOWN3 - 8" COLLARS,MOTOR AND SHOCKSUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELDPRE-JOB SAFETYMEETING. RIG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASINGAS FOLLOWS: GUIDE SHOE, 1 FLOAT
JOINT, FLOATCOLLAR,76JTS CASING. RANTOTALOF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASING SHOE
LANDED AT 3400', FLOAT COLLARAT 3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS5' ABOVE SHOE, FIRST JOINT, NEXT JT,
THEN EVERYSTHJT. TACKWELDED SHOE & TOP AND BUTTOM OF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLEDPLUGRETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCHTO SCHLUMBERGER,LEADW/285SXS "G"WITH 5% D44, 12% D20, 1% D79, .25% Dl12, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0 PPG,YIELD 3.91.TAIL WITH320 SXS "G"W/10% DS3,2% Sl, .25 PPS D29, MIXED AT
14.2 PPGYlELD l.61. DROPPED PLUG AND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLSWATER, DID NOT BUMPPLUG, HAD
FULLRETURNSTHROUGHOUTJOB WITH 50 BBLSCEMENT TO SURFACE. RELEASE PSI, FLOAT EQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER, SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSGWITH98K STRINGWT.
04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUEND DIVERTERAND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETYMEETING:OIL SPILLSAND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NOTIFIED UTAH DOG&M OF INTENT TO SET AND CEMENTINTERMEDIATECASING(LEFTCAROL
DANIELSA MESSAGE)AT09:30AM, 8/15/04
RECIEVED73 JTS 9 5/8" CASINGFROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TOTAL PIPE ON LOCATION
3451'

FORMATION:GREENRIVER35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKEFINALCUTON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOGWITH SCHLUMBERGERWHILENU BOP'S.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:0SS517

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTEDBLINDRAMS,PIPE RAMS, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE AND ALL RELATEDVALVESTO 250 & 5000 PSI.
TESTEDHYDRIL250 & 2500 PSI WITHB&CQU1CKTEST, ALL TESTS 10 MINUTES. TESTED CASINGTO 1500
PSI FOR30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEARBUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKEUP HYCALOGDSX210JETTED .85 TFA ONA HUNTING7/8 LOBE 2.9 STAGE MOTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLE WITH SAME TO TOP OF CEMENT,

19:00 20:30 1.5 DRILLCEMENT& FLOATEQUIPMENT.DRILL 10'NEW HOLE TO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN,

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FIT TEST TO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENT WITH 8.4 PPG WATERIN HOLEAND 690 PSI. APPLIED PS),
HELDFOR 15 MIN,OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE W/MUTOR 3410' TO 3680'(270') 77.l'lHR, 18KWOB,57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY@3598', 1/4DEG.
01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3680' TO 4115' (435') 87'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTINGINU BOP/CUT DRILL LINE

TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION:GREENRIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST, 35% LS
BGG34, CG 83, HG 465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling . Completion Well Total

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATEW/MOTOR 4115' TO 4198'(83') 83'/HR, 18K WOB,57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.
07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL& ROTATE4198' TO 4668'(470') 94'lHR, ISK WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL & ROTATE 4668' TO 5175'(507') 92.1'/HR, 20/22KWOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY@5095', 1 1/2DEG.
19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL& ROTATE5175' TO 6040'(865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200--250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING: SLINGINGPIPE FROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROM V-DOOR/SLICKLINE SURVEYS/BOP
DRILL 1 MIN40 SEC
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH@4124', 55% SH,25% SS, 15%SLTST, 5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling -- Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,470. TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:0SS517

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTEDBLINDRAMS,PIPE RAMS, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE AND ALL RELATEDVALVESTO 250 & 5000 PSI.
TESTEDHYDRIL250 & 2500 PSI WITHB&CQU1CKTEST, ALL TESTS 10 MINUTES. TESTED CASINGTO 1500
PSI FOR30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEARBUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKEUP HYCALOGDSX210JETTED .85 TFA ONA HUNTING7/8 LOBE 2.9 STAGE MOTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLE WITH SAME TO TOP OF CEMENT,

19:00 20:30 1.5 DRILLCEMENT& FLOATEQUIPMENT.DRILL 10'NEW HOLE TO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN,

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FIT TEST TO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENT WITH 8.4 PPG WATERIN HOLEAND 690 PSI. APPLIED PS),
HELDFOR 15 MIN,OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE W/MUTOR 3410' TO 3680'(270') 77.l'lHR, 18KWOB,57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY@3598', 1/4DEG.
01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3680' TO 4115' (435') 87'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTINGINU BOP/CUT DRILL LINE

TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION:GREENRIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST, 35% LS
BGG34, CG 83, HG 465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling . Completion Well Total

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATEW/MOTOR 4115' TO 4198'(83') 83'/HR, 18K WOB,57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.
07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL& ROTATE4198' TO 4668'(470') 94'lHR, ISK WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL & ROTATE 4668' TO 5175'(507') 92.1'/HR, 20/22KWOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY@5095', 1 1/2DEG.
19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL& ROTATE5175' TO 6040'(865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200--250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING: SLINGINGPIPE FROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROM V-DOOR/SLICKLINE SURVEYS/BOP
DRILL 1 MIN40 SEC
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH@4124', 55% SH,25% SS, 15%SLTST, 5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling -- Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,470. TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:0SS517

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTEDBLINDRAMS,PIPE RAMS, FLOOR VALVES, CHOKE AND ALL RELATEDVALVESTO 250 & 5000 PSI.
TESTEDHYDRIL250 & 2500 PSI WITHB&CQU1CKTEST, ALL TESTS 10 MINUTES. TESTED CASINGTO 1500
PSI FOR30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEARBUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKEUP HYCALOGDSX210JETTED .85 TFA ONA HUNTING7/8 LOBE 2.9 STAGE MOTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLE WITH SAME TO TOP OF CEMENT,

19:00 20:30 1.5 DRILLCEMENT& FLOATEQUIPMENT.DRILL 10'NEW HOLE TO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN,

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FIT TEST TO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENT WITH 8.4 PPG WATERIN HOLEAND 690 PSI. APPLIED PS),
HELDFOR 15 MIN,OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE W/MUTOR 3410' TO 3680'(270') 77.l'lHR, 18KWOB,57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY@3598', 1/4DEG.
01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3680' TO 4115' (435') 87'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTINGINU BOP/CUT DRILL LINE

TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION:GREENRIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST, 35% LS
BGG34, CG 83, HG 465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling . Completion Well Total

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL& ROTATEW/MOTOR 4115' TO 4198'(83') 83'/HR, 18K WOB,57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.
07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL& ROTATE4198' TO 4668'(470') 94'lHR, ISK WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY @4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL & ROTATE 4668' TO 5175'(507') 92.1'/HR, 20/22KWOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY@5095', 1 1/2DEG.
19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL& ROTATE5175' TO 6040'(865') 78.6'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200--250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING: SLINGINGPIPE FROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROM V-DOOR/SLICKLINE SURVEYS/BOP
DRILL 1 MIN40 SEC
TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH@4124', 55% SH,25% SS, 15%SLTST, 5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling -- Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,470. TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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WellName:STATE01-32 Field' BIG SPRING Property:0SSS17

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATEWlMOTOR6040' TO 6146' (106') 106'lHR, 18/20KWOB,57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF. BOP DRILL
1MIN,40 SEC.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @6064', 1 3/4 DEG.

07:30 11:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE 6146' TO 6451'(305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRILL, FLOOR VALVES & CHECKEDCROWN-O-MATIC. BOP DRILL
DAYS 1 MIN, 50 SEC.

12:00 23:30 1L5 DRILL ROTATE 6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.l'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY@7089', 2 DEG.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL & ROTATE 7131' TO 7470'(339') 56.5'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:CHANGINGOIL/LOADINGAND UNLOADING/WORKINGIN RAIN

TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION: NORTH HORN @6300', 65% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST

08-20--2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion We11Total

MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL & ROTATEW/MOTOR 7470' TO 7809' (339') 48.4'/HR, IS/22KWOB,22/57/46RPM, 100-150 DIFF.
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL & CHECKEDCROWN-O-MATIC.

13;30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE 7809' TO 8384'(575') 34.8'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

STARTED LIGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETY MEETING:MIXINGCHEMICAL/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION:DARKCANYONTOP@8280', 79% SH,20% SS, 10%SLTST

08--21-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL ROTATE 8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'/HR. 20/22K WOB,57/46 RPM, 100 DIFF.

08:00 12:00 4.0 SLUG, DROP SURVEY, PULL OUTOF HOLE FOR BIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAGON FIRST S STANDS, CLEAN
WITH NO DRAGAFTER THAT. SURVEY @8400'- 2 DEG.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTIONTEST BLINDS,RAMS, CHOKE,FLOORVALVES.
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WellName:STATE01-32 Field' BIG SPRING Property:0SSS17

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATEWlMOTOR6040' TO 6146' (106') 106'lHR, 18/20KWOB,57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF. BOP DRILL
1MIN,40 SEC.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @6064', 1 3/4 DEG.

07:30 11:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE 6146' TO 6451'(305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRILL, FLOOR VALVES & CHECKEDCROWN-O-MATIC. BOP DRILL
DAYS 1 MIN, 50 SEC.

12:00 23:30 1L5 DRILL ROTATE 6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.l'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY@7089', 2 DEG.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL & ROTATE 7131' TO 7470'(339') 56.5'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:CHANGINGOIL/LOADINGAND UNLOADING/WORKINGIN RAIN

TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION: NORTH HORN @6300', 65% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST

08-20--2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion We11Total

MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL & ROTATEW/MOTOR 7470' TO 7809' (339') 48.4'/HR, IS/22KWOB,22/57/46RPM, 100-150 DIFF.
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL & CHECKEDCROWN-O-MATIC.

13;30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE 7809' TO 8384'(575') 34.8'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

STARTED LIGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETY MEETING:MIXINGCHEMICAL/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION:DARKCANYONTOP@8280', 79% SH,20% SS, 10%SLTST

08--21-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL ROTATE 8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'/HR. 20/22K WOB,57/46 RPM, 100 DIFF.

08:00 12:00 4.0 SLUG, DROP SURVEY, PULL OUTOF HOLE FOR BIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAGON FIRST S STANDS, CLEAN
WITH NO DRAGAFTER THAT. SURVEY @8400'- 2 DEG.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTIONTEST BLINDS,RAMS, CHOKE,FLOORVALVES.
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WellName:STATE01-32 Field' BIG SPRING Property:0SSS17

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATEWlMOTOR6040' TO 6146' (106') 106'lHR, 18/20KWOB,57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF. BOP DRILL
1MIN,40 SEC.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @6064', 1 3/4 DEG.

07:30 11:30 4.0 DRILL& ROTATE 6146' TO 6451'(305') 76.2'/HR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRILL, FLOOR VALVES & CHECKEDCROWN-O-MATIC. BOP DRILL
DAYS 1 MIN, 50 SEC.

12:00 23:30 1L5 DRILL ROTATE 6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.l'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY@7089', 2 DEG.
00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL & ROTATE 7131' TO 7470'(339') 56.5'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:CHANGINGOIL/LOADINGAND UNLOADING/WORKINGIN RAIN

TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION: NORTH HORN @6300', 65% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST

08-20--2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion We11Total

MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL & ROTATEW/MOTOR 7470' TO 7809' (339') 48.4'/HR, IS/22KWOB,22/57/46RPM, 100-150 DIFF.
13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL & CHECKEDCROWN-O-MATIC.

13;30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & ROTATE 7809' TO 8384'(575') 34.8'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

STARTED LIGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETY MEETING:MIXINGCHEMICAL/WORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION:DARKCANYONTOP@8280', 79% SH,20% SS, 10%SLTST

08--21-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL ROTATE 8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'/HR. 20/22K WOB,57/46 RPM, 100 DIFF.

08:00 12:00 4.0 SLUG, DROP SURVEY, PULL OUTOF HOLE FOR BIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAGON FIRST S STANDS, CLEAN
WITH NO DRAGAFTER THAT. SURVEY @8400'- 2 DEG.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTIONTEST BLINDS,RAMS, CHOKE,FLOORVALVES.
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 - HTCHC506Z JETTED WITH 0.66" TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT. ROLLER REAMERS(ONE AT 30' &
OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGEBUTTONCUTTERSON EACH,TRIP IN HOLE WITH SAME.

16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30'OF FILL ON BUTTOM. PATTERN BIT.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL8429' TO 9090' (661') 48.9'lHR. 28/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNING WATER AROUND ELECTICAL OUTLETS, TRIPPING,IMPORTANCEOF USING
STATICLINE.

WEATHER:58 DEG.PARTLYCLOUDY,CALM

FORMAT10N:PRICERIVERTOP @8549', 40%SH,50% SS, 10%SLTST.
BGG-30, CG-52,.TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') 55.6'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.
11:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY @9326' - 2 1/4 DEG.

12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL9368' TO 9675'(307') 61.4'/HR. 30KWOB,58 RPM. RAISEWT TO 9.5 PPGAT9400'
17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTIONTEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

17:30 18:00 0.5 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD INSERT AND FLOW SENSOR.

l8:00 06:00 12.0 DRlLL 9675' TO 10195'(520') 43.3'/HR. 30K-WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10 PPG PRIOR TO THE
BLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PS1 LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.
WEATHER 53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST, 20% CARB SH.

BGG3747, CG 1306, HIGH GAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 MW 10.5 Visc 40.0

Formation : . PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227'TO 10250'(23') 5.I'/HR. 14/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY, PULLOUTOF HOLEFOR BIT #4. BITWORNFLAT ON SHOULDERTO MATRIX. INNER
CUTTERSIN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX I46HGJW AND TRIPIN HOLETO CASINGSHOE.
20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP& CUT DRILLLINE.
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 - HTCHC506Z JETTED WITH 0.66" TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT. ROLLER REAMERS(ONE AT 30' &
OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGEBUTTONCUTTERSON EACH,TRIP IN HOLE WITH SAME.

16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30'OF FILL ON BUTTOM. PATTERN BIT.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL8429' TO 9090' (661') 48.9'lHR. 28/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNING WATER AROUND ELECTICAL OUTLETS, TRIPPING,IMPORTANCEOF USING
STATICLINE.

WEATHER:58 DEG.PARTLYCLOUDY,CALM

FORMAT10N:PRICERIVERTOP @8549', 40%SH,50% SS, 10%SLTST.
BGG-30, CG-52,.TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') 55.6'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.
11:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY @9326' - 2 1/4 DEG.

12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL9368' TO 9675'(307') 61.4'/HR. 30KWOB,58 RPM. RAISEWT TO 9.5 PPGAT9400'
17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTIONTEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

17:30 18:00 0.5 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD INSERT AND FLOW SENSOR.

l8:00 06:00 12.0 DRlLL 9675' TO 10195'(520') 43.3'/HR. 30K-WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10 PPG PRIOR TO THE
BLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PS1 LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.
WEATHER 53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST, 20% CARB SH.

BGG3747, CG 1306, HIGH GAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 MW 10.5 Visc 40.0

Formation : . PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227'TO 10250'(23') 5.I'/HR. 14/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY, PULLOUTOF HOLEFOR BIT #4. BITWORNFLAT ON SHOULDERTO MATRIX. INNER
CUTTERSIN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX I46HGJW AND TRIPIN HOLETO CASINGSHOE.
20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP& CUT DRILLLINE.
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 - HTCHC506Z JETTED WITH 0.66" TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT. ROLLER REAMERS(ONE AT 30' &
OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGEBUTTONCUTTERSON EACH,TRIP IN HOLE WITH SAME.

16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30'OF FILL ON BUTTOM. PATTERN BIT.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL8429' TO 9090' (661') 48.9'lHR. 28/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:RUNNING WATER AROUND ELECTICAL OUTLETS, TRIPPING,IMPORTANCEOF USING
STATICLINE.

WEATHER:58 DEG.PARTLYCLOUDY,CALM

FORMAT10N:PRICERIVERTOP @8549', 40%SH,50% SS, 10%SLTST.
BGG-30, CG-52,.TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') 55.6'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.
11:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY @9326' - 2 1/4 DEG.

12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL9368' TO 9675'(307') 61.4'/HR. 30KWOB,58 RPM. RAISEWT TO 9.5 PPGAT9400'
17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTIONTEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

17:30 18:00 0.5 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD INSERT AND FLOW SENSOR.

l8:00 06:00 12.0 DRlLL 9675' TO 10195'(520') 43.3'/HR. 30K-WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10 PPG PRIOR TO THE
BLUECASTLEFORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PS1 LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.
WEATHER 53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST, 20% CARB SH.

BGG3747, CG 1306, HIGH GAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 MW 10.5 Visc 40.0

Formation : . PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB,58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227'TO 10250'(23') 5.I'/HR. 14/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG,DROPSURVEY, PULLOUTOF HOLEFOR BIT #4. BITWORNFLAT ON SHOULDERTO MATRIX. INNER
CUTTERSIN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX I46HGJW AND TRIPIN HOLETO CASINGSHOE.
20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP& CUT DRILLLINE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISHIN HOLEFILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.
01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM 71' TO BOTTOM SLOWLY. TORQUEY LAST 20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'/HR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:CHAINS,HOSES,ETC.AROUNDROTARYTABLE,TRIPPINGAND CUTTINGDRILLLINE.

WEATHER: 57 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @5 MPH.

FORMATION:BLUECASTLETOP@9931', 50% SH, 35% SS, 5% SLTST,10%CARB SH.
BGG 2353,CG Sl97, TRIPGAS 6280,HIGHGAS 5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304' (14') 9.3'lHR, 12/14KWOB,58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGEDSWAB& SEATIN PUMPS.
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304' TO 10,350'(46') 13.1'lHR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDHYDRIL& FLOORVALVES.
12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350' TO 10,708' (358') 19.8'/HR, 16/18K WOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKINGON PUMPS
TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWER PRICE RIVER @ 10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, 5% SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL
BGG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES>l'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress .338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708'TO 10,846'(138')27.6'IHR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:00 1I:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDPIPERAMS,HYDRIL AND HCR.

11:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846'TO 11,046'(200') 10.8'/HR, 18KWOB,55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG
TEMP50 DEG

FORMATION: CASTLEGATE TOP @10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST,10% CARB SH, 10%COAL
BGG 2799, CG 5849, HIGHGAS4269
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISHIN HOLEFILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.
01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM 71' TO BOTTOM SLOWLY. TORQUEY LAST 20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'/HR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:CHAINS,HOSES,ETC.AROUNDROTARYTABLE,TRIPPINGAND CUTTINGDRILLLINE.

WEATHER: 57 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @5 MPH.

FORMATION:BLUECASTLETOP@9931', 50% SH, 35% SS, 5% SLTST,10%CARB SH.
BGG 2353,CG Sl97, TRIPGAS 6280,HIGHGAS 5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304' (14') 9.3'lHR, 12/14KWOB,58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGEDSWAB& SEATIN PUMPS.
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304' TO 10,350'(46') 13.1'lHR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDHYDRIL& FLOORVALVES.
12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350' TO 10,708' (358') 19.8'/HR, 16/18K WOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKINGON PUMPS
TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWER PRICE RIVER @ 10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, 5% SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL
BGG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES>l'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress .338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708'TO 10,846'(138')27.6'IHR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:00 1I:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDPIPERAMS,HYDRIL AND HCR.

11:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846'TO 11,046'(200') 10.8'/HR, 18KWOB,55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG
TEMP50 DEG

FORMATION: CASTLEGATE TOP @10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST,10% CARB SH, 10%COAL
BGG 2799, CG 5849, HIGHGAS4269
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISHIN HOLEFILLINGPIPE EVERY35 STANDS.
01:00 02:00 1.0 WASH/REAM 71' TO BOTTOM SLOWLY. TORQUEY LAST 20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'/HR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:CHAINS,HOSES,ETC.AROUNDROTARYTABLE,TRIPPINGAND CUTTINGDRILLLINE.

WEATHER: 57 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @5 MPH.

FORMATION:BLUECASTLETOP@9931', 50% SH, 35% SS, 5% SLTST,10%CARB SH.
BGG 2353,CG Sl97, TRIPGAS 6280,HIGHGAS 5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304' (14') 9.3'lHR, 12/14KWOB,58 RPM.
07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGEDSWAB& SEATIN PUMPS.
08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304' TO 10,350'(46') 13.1'lHR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDHYDRIL& FLOORVALVES.
12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350' TO 10,708' (358') 19.8'/HR, 16/18K WOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETYMEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/WORKINGON PUMPS
TEMP 52°

FORMATION: LOWER PRICE RIVER @ 10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, 5% SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL
BGG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES>l'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress .338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708'TO 10,846'(138')27.6'IHR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:00 1I:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDPIPERAMS,HYDRIL AND HCR.

11:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846'TO 11,046'(200') 10.8'/HR, 18KWOB,55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG
TEMP50 DEG

FORMATION: CASTLEGATE TOP @10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST,10% CARB SH, 10%COAL
BGG 2799, CG 5849, HIGHGAS4269
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLOR/CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 We11Total

MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Visc 45.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL 11,046' TO 11,146'(100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB,57 RPM.
17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPEDSLUG. DROPPEDSURVEY.TOH FOR BIT #5, NO TIGHT SPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE,INNER STRUCTURE

GOOD, WORN CUTTERSAND FLATTENEDCUTTERSON OUTSIDE.
23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKE UP BIT #5, HTC HC506ZAND TIH. WASHED & REAMED LAST 20' WITHOUT MUCH TORQUE.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL 11,146' TO I1,160' (14') 14 FPH, WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: BLACKHAWKTOP@11,112', 35%SH, 50% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, COAL <5%

BGG 2200,TRIP GAS 6000
08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Dally Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 11,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW 11.1 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160'TO 11,650'(490') 20 FPH,WOB 18K, 56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: SUNNYSIDE TOP @11,370', 20% SH, 65% SS, 10%SLTST,5% CARB SH
BG GAS 3284U, CONN GAS 5154U

W-28-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW l1.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNOPEN HOLELOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL I1650'- 11700'TD. REACHED TD @09:30, 8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH, WOB 19K,56 RPM, PP 1550.
09:30 11:00 1.5 CIRCULATED FOR SHORT TRIP.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SHORTTRIP 15STANDS,NO DRAGOR FILL.

12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATED TRIP GASOUT,6900 UNITS. PUMPED PILL.

14:00 19:00 5.0 TOH FORLOGS. SCHLUMBERGERON LOCATION @17:00.
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLOR/CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 We11Total

MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Visc 45.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL 11,046' TO 11,146'(100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB,57 RPM.
17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPEDSLUG. DROPPEDSURVEY.TOH FOR BIT #5, NO TIGHT SPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE,INNER STRUCTURE

GOOD, WORN CUTTERSAND FLATTENEDCUTTERSON OUTSIDE.
23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKE UP BIT #5, HTC HC506ZAND TIH. WASHED & REAMED LAST 20' WITHOUT MUCH TORQUE.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL 11,146' TO I1,160' (14') 14 FPH, WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: BLACKHAWKTOP@11,112', 35%SH, 50% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, COAL <5%

BGG 2200,TRIP GAS 6000
08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Dally Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 11,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW 11.1 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160'TO 11,650'(490') 20 FPH,WOB 18K, 56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: SUNNYSIDE TOP @11,370', 20% SH, 65% SS, 10%SLTST,5% CARB SH
BG GAS 3284U, CONN GAS 5154U

W-28-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW l1.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNOPEN HOLELOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL I1650'- 11700'TD. REACHED TD @09:30, 8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH, WOB 19K,56 RPM, PP 1550.
09:30 11:00 1.5 CIRCULATED FOR SHORT TRIP.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SHORTTRIP 15STANDS,NO DRAGOR FILL.

12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATED TRIP GASOUT,6900 UNITS. PUMPED PILL.

14:00 19:00 5.0 TOH FORLOGS. SCHLUMBERGERON LOCATION @17:00.
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLOR/CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 We11Total

MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Visc 45.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL 11,046' TO 11,146'(100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB,57 RPM.
17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPEDSLUG. DROPPEDSURVEY.TOH FOR BIT #5, NO TIGHT SPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE,INNER STRUCTURE

GOOD, WORN CUTTERSAND FLATTENEDCUTTERSON OUTSIDE.
23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKE UP BIT #5, HTC HC506ZAND TIH. WASHED & REAMED LAST 20' WITHOUT MUCH TORQUE.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL 11,146' TO I1,160' (14') 14 FPH, WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: BLACKHAWKTOP@11,112', 35%SH, 50% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, COAL <5%

BGG 2200,TRIP GAS 6000
08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Dally Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 11,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW 11.1 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160'TO 11,650'(490') 20 FPH,WOB 18K, 56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: SUNNYSIDE TOP @11,370', 20% SH, 65% SS, 10%SLTST,5% CARB SH
BG GAS 3284U, CONN GAS 5154U

W-28-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion 50 Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW l1.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUNOPEN HOLELOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL I1650'- 11700'TD. REACHED TD @09:30, 8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH, WOB 19K,56 RPM, PP 1550.
09:30 11:00 1.5 CIRCULATED FOR SHORT TRIP.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SHORTTRIP 15STANDS,NO DRAGOR FILL.

12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATED TRIP GASOUT,6900 UNITS. PUMPED PILL.

14:00 19:00 5.0 TOH FORLOGS. SCHLUMBERGERON LOCATION @17:00.
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Well Name: STATE0I-32 Field* BIGSPRING Property: 055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETY MEETING. RU SCHLUMBERGER.LOGGINGWELL. LOGSRUN: PLATFORM EXPRESS WITH
DIPOLESONICFROM TD TO BASE OF INT CASING. ROTARY SIDEWALL CORES IN NEXT RUNS.

SAFETY MEETING: LOGGING

08-29-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FISHINGROTARY CORINGTOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGW/SCHLUMBERGER.FINISHED RUNNINGPLATFORMEXPRESS& DIPOLE SONIC,LOGGERSTD

WAS I1,706'.

07;00 09:00 2.0 WAIT ON ORDERS (CORE POlNTS OFF OF LOGS). RECEIVED COREPOINTSFROMGEOLOGY DEPT.
09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARYSIDEWALL CORE TOOL, MADE ONE CORE@I I,653'AND WASSTUCK.
12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKEDTOOL, TRIED TO GET FREE WITH NO PROGRESSWHILE WAITING ON WEATHERFORD

FISHERMAN & TOOLS.

17:00 20:00 3.0 RUWEATHERFORDTO STRIP OVER WIRELINEAND FISHTOOL.SAFETY MEETING:DON'T GET IN A
HURRY.

20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPINGOVERWIRELINE, CAME LOOSE@4185'.

01:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINE TOGETHER AND PULLEDTOOL INTO OVERSHOT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 PULLED LINEOUTOF TOOL AND POH W/ELECTRICCABLE.

SAFETY MEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTED CAROL DANIELSW/UOGMAT 10:30AM, 8/26/04 TO NUTIFY OF PRODUCTION CASING
CEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTEDDAN JARVIS (LEFT MESSAGE,NOAFTER-HOURS NUMBER) W/UTAH
DNRAT 11:30AM, 8-27-04 W/NOTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT, SLURRY & UPDATEDTIMING
FOR PRODUCTION CEMENTJOB.

08-30--2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total .,-..

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Peri: PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 TONWlDP,FISHINGTOOLS & CORE TOOL (FISH). LD FISH.
09:00 10:00 1.0 BREAK DOWN FISHINGTOOLS,REMOVED WEAR BUSHING.
10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH WITRI-CONEBITTO CLEAN OUT AND CONDITIONEHOLE FOR CASING,4'FILL.
15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATED AND CONDITIONEDHOLEFORCASING.
17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP WESTATES CASING SERVICE. LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE.
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Well Name: STATE0I-32 Field* BIGSPRING Property: 055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETY MEETING. RU SCHLUMBERGER.LOGGINGWELL. LOGSRUN: PLATFORM EXPRESS WITH
DIPOLESONICFROM TD TO BASE OF INT CASING. ROTARY SIDEWALL CORES IN NEXT RUNS.

SAFETY MEETING: LOGGING

08-29-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FISHINGROTARY CORINGTOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGW/SCHLUMBERGER.FINISHED RUNNINGPLATFORMEXPRESS& DIPOLE SONIC,LOGGERSTD

WAS I1,706'.

07;00 09:00 2.0 WAIT ON ORDERS (CORE POlNTS OFF OF LOGS). RECEIVED COREPOINTSFROMGEOLOGY DEPT.

09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARYSIDEWALL CORE TOOL, MADE ONE CORE@I I,653'AND WASSTUCK.

12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKEDTOOL, TRIED TO GET FREE WITH NO PROGRESSWHILE WAITING ON WEATHERFORD
FISHERMAN & TOOLS.

17:00 20:00 3.0 RUWEATHERFORDTO STRIP OVER WIRELINEAND FISHTOOL.SAFETY MEETING:DON'T GET IN A
HURRY.

20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPINGOVERWIRELINE, CAME LOOSE@4185'.

01:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINE TOGETHER AND PULLEDTOOL INTO OVERSHOT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 PULLED LINEOUTOF TOOL AND POH W/ELECTRICCABLE.

SAFETY MEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTED CAROL DANIELSW/UOGMAT 10:30AM, 8/26/04 TO NUTIFY OF PRODUCTION CASING
CEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTEDDAN JARVIS (LEFT MESSAGE,NOAFTER-HOURS NUMBER) W/UTAH
DNRAT 11:30AM, 8-27-04 W/NOTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT, SLURRY & UPDATEDTIMING
FOR PRODUCTION CEMENTJOB.

08-30--2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total .,-..

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Peri: PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 TONWlDP,FISHINGTOOLS & CORE TOOL (FISH). LD FISH.
09:00 10:00 1.0 BREAK DOWN FISHINGTOOLS,REMOVED WEAR BUSHING.
10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH WITRI-CONEBITTO CLEAN OUT AND CONDITIONEHOLE FOR CASING,4'FILL.

15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATED AND CONDITIONEDHOLEFORCASING.
17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP WESTATES CASING SERVICE. LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE.
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Well Name: STATE0I-32 Field* BIGSPRING Property: 055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETY MEETING. RU SCHLUMBERGER.LOGGINGWELL. LOGSRUN: PLATFORM EXPRESS WITH
DIPOLESONICFROM TD TO BASE OF INT CASING. ROTARY SIDEWALL CORES IN NEXT RUNS.

SAFETY MEETING: LOGGING

08-29-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion 50 Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FISHINGROTARY CORINGTOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGW/SCHLUMBERGER.FINISHED RUNNINGPLATFORMEXPRESS& DIPOLE SONIC,LOGGERSTD

WAS I1,706'.

07;00 09:00 2.0 WAIT ON ORDERS (CORE POlNTS OFF OF LOGS). RECEIVED COREPOINTSFROMGEOLOGY DEPT.

09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARYSIDEWALL CORE TOOL, MADE ONE CORE@I I,653'AND WASSTUCK.

12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKEDTOOL, TRIED TO GET FREE WITH NO PROGRESSWHILE WAITING ON WEATHERFORD
FISHERMAN & TOOLS.

17:00 20:00 3.0 RUWEATHERFORDTO STRIP OVER WIRELINEAND FISHTOOL.SAFETY MEETING:DON'T GET IN A
HURRY.

20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPINGOVERWIRELINE, CAME LOOSE@4185'.

01:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINE TOGETHER AND PULLEDTOOL INTO OVERSHOT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 PULLED LINEOUTOF TOOL AND POH W/ELECTRICCABLE.

SAFETY MEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTED CAROL DANIELSW/UOGMAT 10:30AM, 8/26/04 TO NUTIFY OF PRODUCTION CASING
CEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTEDDAN JARVIS (LEFT MESSAGE,NOAFTER-HOURS NUMBER) W/UTAH
DNRAT 11:30AM, 8-27-04 W/NOTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT, SLURRY & UPDATEDTIMING
FOR PRODUCTION CEMENTJOB.

08-30--2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $0 Daily Total .,-..

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $0 Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Peri: PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 TONWlDP,FISHINGTOOLS & CORE TOOL (FISH). LD FISH.
09:00 10:00 1.0 BREAK DOWN FISHINGTOOLS,REMOVED WEAR BUSHING.
10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH WITRI-CONEBITTO CLEAN OUT AND CONDITIONEHOLE FOR CASING,4'FILL.

15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATED AND CONDITIONEDHOLEFORCASING.
17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP WESTATES CASING SERVICE. LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE.
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WellName:STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

02:00 06:00 4.0 RUWESTATESCASINGTOOLS. SAFETYMEETING. RUN 4 1/2", 11.6#, P-110, LTC CASINGAS FOLLOWS:
FLOAT SHOE, 1JT CASING,FLOAT COLLAR, CASING. CENTRALIZERSON MIDDLE FIRST JOINT, EVERY
OTHER JOINTTO 8800'(37 TOTAL). MARKERJOINTS@901l'AND 6336'. (4100'OF CASINGPICKED UP @
REPORT TIME).

SAFETYMEETING:LD DRILL PIPE

08-31-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total e-

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 19 MW I1.0 Visc 44.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 FINISHED RUNNINGTOTALOF 293 JOINTS(291 FULLJTS + 2 - 20' MARKER JOINTS) OF 4 1/2", 11.6#,HC P-

110,LTCCASING. SHOE DEPTH 11,695', FLOAT COLLAR 11,652', 20' MARKER JTS 8989-9009' & 6334-6354'.
NO TIGHT SPOTSOR FILL. STRINGWEIGHT I12,000# BEFORECEMENTING.

09:00 11:00 2.0 ClRCULATED FOR CEMENT.

11:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELLTO CEMENT. SAFETYMEETING. PRESSURETESTED LINES TO 5,000 PSI.
PUMPJOBAS FOLLOWS: 20 BBLS MUD FLUSH, 20 BBLS H2OAHEAD, LEAD SLURRY:713 SX (2182 CU/FT) G
HI LIFT, 3.05YLD, 115 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H20, + 12%D020 +1% 0079 +

.2% Dt67 + .2% DO46 + 2% D013 + .

25#/SK DO29. TAIL SLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, 1.29 YLD, 14.1 PPG, 5.96 GAL/SK H2O, + 2%
DO20+ .1% DO46+

.1% DOl3 +
.2% Dl67 +

,2% DO65.DROPPEDPLUGAND DISPLACED W/185.8 BBL H2O.
MAX PRESSURE 2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUG TO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK .2 BBL, FLOATS HELD. RD
SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL. PU BOPAND SET SLIPS W/80,000 LBS (NO BLOCK WEIGHT). EST TOP OF
CEMENT4,000'.

15.00 18:00 3.0 CLEANED MUD TANKS.
18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVINGRIGTO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL COMPLETION

COMMENCES.

SAFETYMEETING:RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.
CASINGPOINT CO!

DIESEL TRANSFERRED TO STAGECOACHUNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS @51.40/GAL
09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD I1,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRACBLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10MBOPE. RUCUTTERS WL. RaN CBL/VDL/GR/CCLFROMPBTD TO 8000' &ACROSSCEMENTTOP @

3550'. RDWL PRESSURETESTED CASING, BOPE& FLOW EQUIPMENTTO 8500 PSIG FOR 15 MIN. SDFN.
09-04-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion . Well Total
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WellName:STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

02:00 06:00 4.0 RUWESTATESCASINGTOOLS. SAFETYMEETING. RUN 4 1/2", 11.6#, P-110, LTC CASINGAS FOLLOWS:
FLOAT SHOE, 1JT CASING,FLOAT COLLAR, CASING. CENTRALIZERSON MIDDLE FIRST JOINT, EVERY
OTHER JOINTTO 8800'(37 TOTAL). MARKERJOINTS@901l'AND 6336'. (4100'OF CASINGPICKED UP @
REPORT TIME).

SAFETYMEETING:LD DRILL PIPE

08-31-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total e-

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 19 MW I1.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 FINISHED RUNNINGTOTALOF 293 JOINTS(291 FULLJTS + 2 - 20' MARKER JOINTS) OF 4 1/2", 11.6#,HC P-

110,LTCCASING. SHOE DEPTH 11,695', FLOAT COLLAR 11,652', 20' MARKER JTS 8989-9009' & 6334-6354'.
NO TIGHT SPOTSOR FILL. STRINGWEIGHT I12,000# BEFORECEMENTING.

09:00 11:00 2.0 ClRCULATED FOR CEMENT.

11:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELLTO CEMENT. SAFETYMEETING. PRESSURETESTED LINES TO 5,000 PSI.
PUMPJOBAS FOLLOWS: 20 BBLS MUD FLUSH, 20 BBLS H2OAHEAD, LEAD SLURRY:713 SX (2182 CU/FT) G
HI LIFT, 3.05YLD, 115 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H20, + 12%D020 +1% 0079 +

.2% Dt67 + .2% DO46 + 2% D013 + .

25#/SK DO29. TAIL SLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, 1.29 YLD, 14.1 PPG, 5.96 GAL/SK H2O, + 2%
DO20+ .1% DO46+

.1% DOl3 +
.2% Dl67 +

,2% DO65.DROPPEDPLUGAND DISPLACED W/185.8 BBL H2O.
MAX PRESSURE 2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUG TO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK .2 BBL, FLOATS HELD. RD
SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL. PU BOPAND SET SLIPS W/80,000 LBS (NO BLOCK WEIGHT). EST TOP OF
CEMENT4,000'.

15.00 18:00 3.0 CLEANED MUD TANKS.
18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVINGRIGTO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL COMPLETION

COMMENCES.

SAFETYMEETING:RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.
CASINGPOINT CO!

DIESEL TRANSFERRED TO STAGECOACHUNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS @51.40/GAL
09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD I1,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRACBLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10MBOPE. RUCUTTERS WL. RaN CBL/VDL/GR/CCLFROMPBTD TO 8000' &ACROSSCEMENTTOP @

3550'. RDWL PRESSURETESTED CASING, BOPE& FLOW EQUIPMENTTO 8500 PSIG FOR 15 MIN. SDFN.
09-04-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion . Well Total
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WellName:STATE01-32 Field:BIG SPRING Property:055517

02:00 06:00 4.0 RUWESTATESCASINGTOOLS. SAFETYMEETING. RUN 4 1/2", 11.6#, P-110, LTC CASINGAS FOLLOWS:
FLOAT SHOE, 1JT CASING,FLOAT COLLAR, CASING. CENTRALIZERSON MIDDLE FIRST JOINT, EVERY
OTHER JOINTTO 8800'(37 TOTAL). MARKERJOINTS@901l'AND 6336'. (4100'OF CASINGPICKED UP @
REPORT TIME).

SAFETYMEETING:LD DRILL PIPE

08-31-2004 Reported By PATCLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total e-

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 19 MW I1.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 FINISHED RUNNINGTOTALOF 293 JOINTS(291 FULLJTS + 2 - 20' MARKER JOINTS) OF 4 1/2", 11.6#,HC P-

110,LTCCASING. SHOE DEPTH 11,695', FLOAT COLLAR 11,652', 20' MARKER JTS 8989-9009' & 6334-6354'.
NO TIGHT SPOTSOR FILL. STRINGWEIGHT I12,000# BEFORECEMENTING.

09:00 11:00 2.0 ClRCULATED FOR CEMENT.

11:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELLTO CEMENT. SAFETYMEETING. PRESSURETESTED LINES TO 5,000 PSI.
PUMPJOBAS FOLLOWS: 20 BBLS MUD FLUSH, 20 BBLS H2OAHEAD, LEAD SLURRY:713 SX (2182 CU/FT) G
HI LIFT, 3.05YLD, 115 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H20, + 12%D020 +1% 0079 +

.2% Dt67 + .2% DO46 + 2% D013 + .

25#/SK DO29. TAIL SLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, 1.29 YLD, 14.1 PPG, 5.96 GAL/SK H2O, + 2%
DO20+ .1% DO46+

.1% DOl3 +
.2% Dl67 +

,2% DO65.DROPPEDPLUGAND DISPLACED W/185.8 BBL H2O.
MAX PRESSURE 2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUG TO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK .2 BBL, FLOATS HELD. RD
SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL. PU BOPAND SET SLIPS W/80,000 LBS (NO BLOCK WEIGHT). EST TOP OF
CEMENT4,000'.

15.00 18:00 3.0 CLEANED MUD TANKS.
18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVINGRIGTO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL COMPLETION

COMMENCES.

SAFETYMEETING:RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.
CASINGPOINT CO!

DIESEL TRANSFERRED TO STAGECOACHUNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS @51.40/GAL
09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD I1,700 TVD I1,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FRACBLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10MBOPE. RUCUTTERS WL. RaN CBL/VDL/GR/CCLFROMPBTD TO 8000' &ACROSSCEMENTTOP @

3550'. RDWL PRESSURETESTED CASING, BOPE& FLOW EQUIPMENTTO 8500 PSIG FOR 15 MIN. SDFN.
09-04-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion . Well Total
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:'BIG SPRING Property: 055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATEDSUNNYSIDE FROM l1391'-93', 11406'-09', 11433'-34', I1462'-63', 11485'-8T

& 11503'-05'Wl3-1/8" HSC PORTEDCASING GUNS @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASINGW/4959GALYFl25ST PAD, 45,381 GAL YFl25ST & YF118ST &
168,556# 20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8348PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 6671 PSIG. ATR 46.2 BPM. ISIP 4200
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K COMPOSITEFRACPLUG @11323'. PERFORATED BLACKHAWKFROM 11l22'-25', 11153-

55', 11229'-30', I1249'-50', 11274'-76'& l1289'-91'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRACDOWN CASINGW/4973 GAL YF125ST PAD, 58580 GALYFl25ST & YFI18ST & 243,775#20/40 SAND @1-
6 PPG. MTP 8381 PSIG. MTR 49.7 BPM. ATP$671 PSIG. ATR 42.8 BPM. ISIP 5600 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED16HRS. 12/64"CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIO. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED ll 10 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.

09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling so Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200 PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED 920 BLW. 1220 BLWTR.

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion ' Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I 1652.0 Perf : I l 122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS. 24/64"CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARINGBETWEEN FLUID SLUGS. MINIMAL

CONDENSATE. RECOVERED790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completior Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRSON 24/64CHOKE. FCP 150 PSIG. EST 10-12 BPH. RECOVERED 265 BLW. 525 BLWTR. FLUID

COMMING IN SLUGSNOT CONSTANTFLOW.

09-08-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:'BIG SPRING Property: 055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATEDSUNNYSIDE FROM l1391'-93', 11406'-09', 11433'-34', I1462'-63', 11485'-8T

& 11503'-05'Wl3-1/8" HSC PORTEDCASING GUNS @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASINGW/4959GALYFl25ST PAD, 45,381 GAL YFl25ST & YF118ST &
168,556# 20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8348PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 6671 PSIG. ATR 46.2 BPM. ISIP 4200
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K COMPOSITEFRACPLUG @11323'. PERFORATED BLACKHAWKFROM 11l22'-25', 11153-

55', 11229'-30', I1249'-50', 11274'-76'& l1289'-91'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRACDOWN CASINGW/4973 GAL YF125ST PAD, 58580 GALYFl25ST & YFI18ST & 243,775#20/40 SAND @1-
6 PPG. MTP 8381 PSIG. MTR 49.7 BPM. ATP$671 PSIG. ATR 42.8 BPM. ISIP 5600 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED16HRS. 12/64"CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIO. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED ll 10 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.

09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling so Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200 PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED 920 BLW. 1220 BLWTR.

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion ' Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I 1652.0 Perf : I l 122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS. 24/64"CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARINGBETWEEN FLUID SLUGS. MINIMAL

CONDENSATE. RECOVERED790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completior Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRSON 24/64CHOKE. FCP 150 PSIG. EST 10-12 BPH. RECOVERED 265 BLW. 525 BLWTR. FLUID

COMMING IN SLUGSNOT CONSTANTFLOW.

09-08-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Page

Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field:'BIG SPRING Property: 055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATEDSUNNYSIDE FROM l1391'-93', 11406'-09', 11433'-34', I1462'-63', 11485'-8T

& 11503'-05'Wl3-1/8" HSC PORTEDCASING GUNS @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASINGW/4959GALYFl25ST PAD, 45,381 GAL YFl25ST & YF118ST &
168,556# 20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8348PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 6671 PSIG. ATR 46.2 BPM. ISIP 4200
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K COMPOSITEFRACPLUG @11323'. PERFORATED BLACKHAWKFROM 11l22'-25', 11153-

55', 11229'-30', I1249'-50', 11274'-76'& l1289'-91'@ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRACDOWN CASINGW/4973 GAL YF125ST PAD, 58580 GALYFl25ST & YFI18ST & 243,775#20/40 SAND @1-
6 PPG. MTP 8381 PSIG. MTR 49.7 BPM. ATP$671 PSIG. ATR 42.8 BPM. ISIP 5600 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED16HRS. 12/64"CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIO. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED ll 10 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.

09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling so Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200 PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED 920 BLW. 1220 BLWTR.

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion ' Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WellTotal

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I 1652.0 Perf : I l 122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS. 24/64"CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARINGBETWEEN FLUID SLUGS. MINIMAL

CONDENSATE. RECOVERED790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completior Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRSON 24/64CHOKE. FCP 150 PSIG. EST 10-12 BPH. RECOVERED 265 BLW. 525 BLWTR. FLUID

COMMING IN SLUGSNOT CONSTANTFLOW.

09-08-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 FicldiBIG SPRING Property:055517

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 Tyg 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I 1652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRSON 24/64"CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSlG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 252 BLW. 273 BLWTR.

MIRUDUCO RIG #3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling '

Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : I l 122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE & BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUG@11,323'. RlH. FILL

@11,469'. CLEANED OUT TO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion --- Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD I1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0 -
Activity at Report Time: POH WITUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 0 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS & WELL STARTED FLOWING.

RECOVERED44 BLW. FLOWED 4 HRS. ON 32/64" CHOKE& LOGGED OFF. MADE 14SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTED FLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPEN CHOKE & LOGGED OFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELLOPENON 16/64" CHOKE OVERNIGHT. 115 BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf: 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: MOVE IN FRAC FLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00 AM, 16/64" CHOKE,FTP 0 PSIG,CP 1750 PSlG. CIRCULATED WELL WITREATEDWATER. POH. RU

COMPUTALOGWL. SET CIBP@l 1,100'.

PERFORATED CASTLEGATEFROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32'& l l,065-66' W/3-
1/8" HSC PORTED CASING GUNS @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion --,. -- Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 FicldiBIG SPRING Property:055517

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 Tyg 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I 1652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRSON 24/64"CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSlG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 252 BLW. 273 BLWTR.

MIRUDUCO RIG #3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling

'
Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : I l 122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE & BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUG@11,323'. RlH. FILL

@11,469'. CLEANED OUT TO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion --- Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD I1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0 -
Activity at Report Time: POH WITUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 0 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS & WELL STARTED FLOWING.

RECOVERED44 BLW. FLOWED 4 HRS. ON 32/64" CHOKE& LOGGED OFF. MADE 14SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTED FLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPEN CHOKE & LOGGED OFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELLOPENON 16/64" CHOKE OVERNIGHT. 115 BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf: 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: MOVE IN FRAC FLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00 AM, 16/64" CHOKE,FTP 0 PSIG,CP 1750 PSlG. CIRCULATED WELL WITREATEDWATER. POH. RU

COMPUTALOGWL. SET CIBP@l 1,100'.

PERFORATED CASTLEGATEFROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32'& l l,065-66' W/3-
1/8" HSC PORTED CASING GUNS @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion --,. -- Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 FicldiBIG SPRING Property:055517

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 Tyg 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I 1652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRSON 24/64"CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSlG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 252 BLW. 273 BLWTR.

MIRUDUCO RIG #3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling

'
Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : I l 122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE & BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUG@11,323'. RlH. FILL

@11,469'. CLEANED OUT TO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion --- Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD I1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0 -
Activity at Report Time: POH WITUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 0 PSIG. RU TO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS & WELL STARTED FLOWING.

RECOVERED44 BLW. FLOWED 4 HRS. ON 32/64" CHOKE& LOGGED OFF. MADE 14SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTED FLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPEN CHOKE & LOGGED OFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELLOPENON 16/64" CHOKE OVERNIGHT. 115 BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf: 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: MOVE IN FRAC FLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00 AM, 16/64" CHOKE,FTP 0 PSIG,CP 1750 PSlG. CIRCULATED WELL WITREATEDWATER. POH. RU

COMPUTALOGWL. SET CIBP@l 1,100'.

PERFORATED CASTLEGATEFROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32'& l l,065-66' W/3-
1/8" HSC PORTED CASING GUNS @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SICP 0 PSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion --,. -- Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field:sBIGSPRING Property:055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERPARE FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PREP TO FRAC.

09-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10635-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLUE CASTLE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC CASTLEGATE DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALYFl25ST PAD, 53,760 GALSYF125ST

&YF118ST& 212,500#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. SCREENED OUT W/40 BBLS FLUSH REMAINING. 206,300#
SAND IN FORMATION. MTP 8588 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP6933PSIG. ATR44.2 BPM. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
FLOWED3.5 HRSTHROUGH10/64"& 24/64"CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED 289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR,
SLIGHT SAND.

RUWL. PERFORATEDNELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52'@
2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SET COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,882'. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGERPUMPS.
FRACED DOWNCASINGW/5000GALS YFl25ST PAD, 49,518 GALS YF125ST & YFl18ST & 193,000# 20/40
SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8555 PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP7546PSIG. ATR 37 BPM. ISIP 4625 PSIG. SDFN.

09-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completior «t Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3700 PSIG. RUWL. SET WEATHERFORD COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,359'. PERFED BLUE CASTLE

FROM 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14' & 10,323-25'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL
RU SCHLUMBERGER.FRACED DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALSYF12ST PAD,38,430 GALSYF125ST& YF118ST
& 139,100#20/40SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 7712 PSIG. MTR 47.2 BPM. ATP 6218 PSIG. ATR 43 BPM. ISIP 4370
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG @10,225'. UNABLE TO GET OFF PLUG. PULLED OUT OF ROPE
SOCKET. RDWL. (FISH CONSISTSOF 1-7/16" CABLEHEAD, 3-1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR,3-1/8" QUICK
CHANGE, 19'X 3-1/8" CASING GUN, SETTINGTOOLADAPTER,FIRINGHEAD,SETTINGTOOL& SETTING
SLEEVE. OVERALL LENGTH 32.5'). RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 14.25 HRS ON 10/64" TO 24/64" CHOKE. AT5 AM, 24/64"CHOKE,FCP 400 PSIG, 55-60 BFPH.
RECOVERED903 BLW. 2996 BLWTR.

09-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total >1,-,. .

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field:sBIGSPRING Property:055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERPARE FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PREP TO FRAC.

09-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10635-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLUE CASTLE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC CASTLEGATE DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALYFl25ST PAD, 53,760 GALSYF125ST

&YF118ST& 212,500#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. SCREENED OUT W/40 BBLS FLUSH REMAINING. 206,300#
SAND IN FORMATION. MTP 8588 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP6933PSIG. ATR44.2 BPM. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
FLOWED3.5 HRSTHROUGH10/64"& 24/64"CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED 289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR,
SLIGHT SAND.

RUWL. PERFORATEDNELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52'@
2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SET COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,882'. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGERPUMPS.
FRACED DOWNCASINGW/5000GALS YFl25ST PAD, 49,518 GALS YF125ST & YFl18ST & 193,000# 20/40
SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8555 PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP7546PSIG. ATR 37 BPM. ISIP 4625 PSIG. SDFN.

09-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completior «t Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3700 PSIG. RUWL. SET WEATHERFORD COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,359'. PERFED BLUE CASTLE

FROM 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14' & 10,323-25'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL
RU SCHLUMBERGER.FRACED DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALSYF12ST PAD,38,430 GALSYF125ST& YF118ST
& 139,100#20/40SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 7712 PSIG. MTR 47.2 BPM. ATP 6218 PSIG. ATR 43 BPM. ISIP 4370
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG @10,225'. UNABLE TO GET OFF PLUG. PULLED OUT OF ROPE
SOCKET. RDWL. (FISH CONSISTSOF 1-7/16" CABLEHEAD, 3-1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR,3-1/8" QUICK
CHANGE, 19'X 3-1/8" CASING GUN, SETTINGTOOLADAPTER,FIRINGHEAD,SETTINGTOOL& SETTING
SLEEVE. OVERALL LENGTH 32.5'). RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 14.25 HRS ON 10/64" TO 24/64" CHOKE. AT5 AM, 24/64"CHOKE,FCP 400 PSIG, 55-60 BFPH.
RECOVERED903 BLW. 2996 BLWTR.

09-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total >1,-,. .

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field:sBIGSPRING Property:055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERPARE FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 PREP TO FRAC.
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Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
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Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10635-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLUE CASTLE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC CASTLEGATE DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALYFl25ST PAD, 53,760 GALSYF125ST

&YF118ST& 212,500#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. SCREENED OUT W/40 BBLS FLUSH REMAINING. 206,300#
SAND IN FORMATION. MTP 8588 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP6933PSIG. ATR44.2 BPM. RD SCHLUMBERGER.
FLOWED3.5 HRSTHROUGH10/64"& 24/64"CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED 289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR,
SLIGHT SAND.

RUWL. PERFORATEDNELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52'@
2 SPF & 180° PHASING. SET COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,882'. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGERPUMPS.
FRACED DOWNCASINGW/5000GALS YFl25ST PAD, 49,518 GALS YF125ST & YFl18ST & 193,000# 20/40
SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8555 PSIG. MTR47.2 BPM. ATP7546PSIG. ATR 37 BPM. ISIP 4625 PSIG. SDFN.

09-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completior «t Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3700 PSIG. RUWL. SET WEATHERFORD COMPOSITEFRACPLUG@10,359'. PERFED BLUE CASTLE

FROM 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14' & 10,323-25'@ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL
RU SCHLUMBERGER.FRACED DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALSYF12ST PAD,38,430 GALSYF125ST& YF118ST
& 139,100#20/40SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 7712 PSIG. MTR 47.2 BPM. ATP 6218 PSIG. ATR 43 BPM. ISIP 4370
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL SET COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG @10,225'. UNABLE TO GET OFF PLUG. PULLED OUT OF ROPE
SOCKET. RDWL. (FISH CONSISTSOF 1-7/16" CABLEHEAD, 3-1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR,3-1/8" QUICK
CHANGE, 19'X 3-1/8" CASING GUN, SETTINGTOOLADAPTER,FIRINGHEAD,SETTINGTOOL& SETTING
SLEEVE. OVERALL LENGTH 32.5'). RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 14.25 HRS ON 10/64" TO 24/64" CHOKE. AT5 AM, 24/64"CHOKE,FCP 400 PSIG, 55-60 BFPH.
RECOVERED903 BLW. 2996 BLWTR.

09-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total >1,-,. .

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Page



Well Name:STATE 01-32 Field:9BIGSPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLFRACPLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 4 HRSON 32/64"CHOKE. FCP 100 PSlG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 48 BLW. 2948 BLWTR. KILLED

WELLW/75BBLSTREATED WATER. RIH W/OVERSHOT, JARS& BUMPERSUBTO 10,210'. CIRCULATED TO
TOP OF FISH@10,225'. LATCHED ONTOFISH. WORKED FISH FREE. POH. LAYEDDOWNFISH & FISHING
TOOLS. RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMPOFF SUB TO 9985'. SDFN.

09-17-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 33 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERF UPPER BLUE CASTLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 1900 PSIG. SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. KILLED TUBINGW/25 BBLSTREATEDWATER. RIH

TO BP @10,225'. POH TO 9993'. DISPLACED HOLE WITREATED WATER. PRESSURE TESTED BP TO 4000
PSIG. POH. SDFN.

8 2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $11,809 Daily Total $11,809
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $621,326 Well Total 51,570,829

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
09:00 12:30 3.5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RUCUTTERS WL. PERFORATED BLUECASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',

10,178-80', 10185-88' & 10,193-95' @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL. SI. WO FRAC.
09-21-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion I Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURINGRIG UP SCHLUMBERGER HADEQUIPMENT FAILURE. SI. WO FRACEQUIPMENT.

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling . Completion -.- Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRACBLUECASTLE DOWN CASINGW/4946GALSYF125ST PAD,

40,903GALS YFl25ST & YF118ST& 145,800#20/40SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6I84 PSIG. ATR 42.4 BPM, ISIP 3875PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.LEFT FRAC HEAD ON BOPs. BLINDRAMS
WOULDNOT FULLYCLOSE.
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Well Name:STATE 01-32 Field:9BIGSPRING Property:055517
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WELLW/75BBLSTREATED WATER. RIH W/OVERSHOT, JARS& BUMPERSUBTO 10,210'. CIRCULATED TO
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PSIG. POH. SDFN.
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MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
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09:00 12:30 3.5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RUCUTTERS WL. PERFORATED BLUECASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',
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Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURINGRIG UP SCHLUMBERGER HADEQUIPMENT FAILURE. SI. WO FRACEQUIPMENT.

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling . Completion -.- Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRACBLUECASTLE DOWN CASINGW/4946GALSYF125ST PAD,

40,903GALS YFl25ST & YF118ST& 145,800#20/40SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6I84 PSIG. ATR 42.4 BPM, ISIP 3875PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.LEFT FRAC HEAD ON BOPs. BLINDRAMS
WOULDNOT FULLYCLOSE.
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Well Name:STATE 01-32 Field:9BIGSPRING Property:055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILLFRACPLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 4 HRSON 32/64"CHOKE. FCP 100 PSlG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 48 BLW. 2948 BLWTR. KILLED
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TO BP @10,225'. POH TO 9993'. DISPLACED HOLE WITREATED WATER. PRESSURE TESTED BP TO 4000
PSIG. POH. SDFN.

8 2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion $11,809 Daily Total $11,809
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion $621,326 Well Total 51,570,829

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description
09:00 12:30 3.5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RUCUTTERS WL. PERFORATED BLUECASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',

10,178-80', 10185-88' & 10,193-95' @2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL. SI. WO FRAC.
09-21-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion I Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
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Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURINGRIG UP SCHLUMBERGER HADEQUIPMENT FAILURE. SI. WO FRACEQUIPMENT.

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling . Completion -.- Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. RUSCHLUMBERGER. FRACBLUECASTLE DOWN CASINGW/4946GALSYF125ST PAD,

40,903GALS YFl25ST & YF118ST& 145,800#20/40SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6I84 PSIG. ATR 42.4 BPM, ISIP 3875PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.LEFT FRAC HEAD ON BOPs. BLINDRAMS
WOULDNOT FULLYCLOSE.
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WellName: STATE 01-32 Field:BIG SPRIWG Property: 055517

FLOWED WELL 21 HRS ON 32/64"CHOKE. FCP450 PSIG. 20 BFPH. RECOVERED 712 BLW. 3495 BLWTR.
09-24-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion ' Well Total

MD l1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 37 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 2 HRS ON AN OPEN CHOKE. FCP 0 PSIG. PUMPED 85 BBLSTREATED WATER DOWN CASING. RIH

Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS@10,225', 10,359'& 10,882'. RIN.
CLEANEDOUTTO CIBP@11,100'. LANDED TUBING@11,061' KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPEDBALL &
PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.

FLOWED10HRSON 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 500 PSIG. CP 500 PSIG. 5-7 BFPH. RECOVERED 180 BLW.3762
BLWTR.

TUBINGDETAIL : LENGTH

PUMP OFFASSEMBLY .91'

l .1T2-3/8" 4.7# N80 EUETUBING 32.61'

XN NIPPLE 1.25'

337 .ITS2-3/8" 4.7# NSOTUBING 11,012.35'
BELOW KB 14.00'

LANDED AT 11,061.12' KB
09-25-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 38 MW . 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : i1652.0 Perf: 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 RDMOSU.

FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP l125 PSIG. 1-3 BFPH. RECOVERED 69 BLW. 3513BLWTR.
09-26-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD I1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 39 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE . PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1000 PSIG. 1 BFPH. RECOVERED 75 BLW. 3438 BLWTR.
06:00
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06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1000 PSIG. 1 BFPH. RECOVERED 75 BLW. 3438 BLWTR.

06:00
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Well Name: STATE01-32 FielddlG SRIUNG Property: 055517

09-27-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 40 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 400 PSIG. CP 1050 PSIG. 1-2 BFPH. TRACEOF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED 75 BLW 3363 BLWTR.

09-28-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 41 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 800 PSIG. CP 1450 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED60 BLW. 3303 BLWTR.
09-29-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf: 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI - WO FURTHERACTIVITY

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 12:00 6.0 FLOWED 6 HRS ON 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 750 PSlG. CP 1500 PSIG. 3-5 BFPH. TRACEOF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED 24 BLW. 3279 BLWTR. SI.

Page

Well Name: STATE01-32 FielddlG SRIUNG Property: 055517

09-27-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 40 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 400 PSIG. CP 1050 PSIG. 1-2 BFPH. TRACEOF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED 75 BLW 3363 BLWTR.

09-28-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 41 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 800 PSIG. CP 1450 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED60 BLW. 3303 BLWTR.
09-29-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf: 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI - WO FURTHERACTIVITY

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 12:00 6.0 FLOWED 6 HRS ON 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 750 PSlG. CP 1500 PSIG. 3-5 BFPH. TRACEOF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED 24 BLW. 3279 BLWTR. SI.

Page

Well Name: STATE01-32 FielddlG SRIUNG Property: 055517

09-27-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 40 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 400 PSIG. CP 1050 PSIG. 1-2 BFPH. TRACEOF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED 75 BLW 3363 BLWTR.

09-28-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 41 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 800 PSIG. CP 1450 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED60 BLW. 3303 BLWTR.
09-29-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf: 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI - WO FURTHERACTIVITY

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 12:00 6.0 FLOWED 6 HRS ON 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 750 PSlG. CP 1500 PSIG. 3-5 BFPH. TRACEOF CONDENSATE.

RECOVERED 24 BLW. 3279 BLWTR. SI.

Page



e . O
STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT O FORM 8

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes)
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

UT ST ML48380

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME

la. TYPE OF WELL: ELLL WGAESLL DRY OTHER
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

b. TYPE OF WORK:
NEW HORIZ. DEEP- RE- DIFF.

8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

WELL LATS- EN ENTRY RESVR O ER STATE 1-32
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 4304735839
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

P.O. BOX 250 CITY BIG PINEY STATE WY ZIP 83113 (307) 276-3331 WILDCAT
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN
ATSURFACE: 2152 FNL 2067 FWL SENE 32 10S 18E S
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW SAME

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTAL DEFTH: SAME UINTAH UTAH

14. DATE SPUDDED: 16. DATE T.D. REACHED: 16. DATECOMPLETED: - - 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL)
8/7/2004 8/27/2004 SHUT-IN ABANDONED R YTOPRODUCE 5585 KB

18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 11,652 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY? * 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD

1 PLUG SET:
TVD TVD TVD

22, TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submit copyofeach) 23

I., TDD ROL OLE AR SONÌCE L WASWELLCORED7 NO YES (Submitanalysis)
¯¯¯

-
--- ASECDTONRAL

URVEY7 ( t y

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set in well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#/ft) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) STAGEDCEMENTER CNE NFSACKES VOLSUMRE
BL) CEMENT TOP * AMOUNT PULLED

17-1/2 13 3/8 H-40 48# 0 239 225
12-1/4 9 5/8 J-55 36# O 3,400 605
7-7/8 4 1/2 P-110 11.6 0 11,695 1551

25. TUBING RECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD} PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2-3/8 11,061
26. PRODuciNG INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL(Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(A) Blackhawk 10,112 11,505 11,391 11,505 2 op•n O Squee ed

(B) 11,122 11,291 2 open O 89u••=•d

<c) 10.893 11.066 2 open O Squeezed

(D) 10,635 10,852 2 openO Squeezed

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPE OF MATERIAL

11391-11505 1199 BBLS GELLED WATER & 168,556 # 20/40 SAND
11,122-11,291 1513 BBLS GELLED WATER & 243,775 # 20/40 SAND
10,893-11,066 1399 BBLS GELLED WATER & 212,500 #20/40 SAND

29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

O ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY SHUT -INO SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUED ON BACK)

OlVOFOILGAS&
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O O
31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item $20)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

I I
RATES: ·· SHUT-IN

CHOKE SI2E: TBG. PRESS CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL; GAS - MCF; WATER - BBL: INTgRVALS ATUS
RATES: a

INTERVALB (As shown in item #28)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER- BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -*

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU-GAS AS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS
RATES: -*

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROO, METHOD:
RATES: -*

CHOKE SIZE: BG. PRESS CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF; WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

INTERVALD (As shown In item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -*

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS CSG. PRESS. PI GRAVITY BTU- GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OlL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -*

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)
SHUT-IN PENDING PIPELINE

33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (include Aquifers); 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof:Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushion used, time toolopen,flowing and shut-In pressures and recoveries.

Formation Bo m Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (MeasumdpDepth)

Wasatch 4,562
Blackhawk 10,112 11,505 Chapita Wells 5,219

Northhorn 6,956
Mesaverde 8,744
Blue Castle Nelson 9,937
Blue Castle 10,230
Castlegate Buck Tongue 10,778
SEGO 10,928
Sunnyside 11,384
Kenilworth 11,661

35. ADDITIONALREMARW (include plu90 n0 procedure)

SEE ATTACHEDSHEET

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined ikom all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRI ) Kaylene R. Gardner TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNAT
,

A I A A A DATE 12/15/2004

This report mu b submittedwithin 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existingwell bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphictests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

** ITEM24: Cement Top -Show how reported top(s)ofcement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey(TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple. Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

O O
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Blackhawk 10,112 11,505 Chapita Wells 5,219

Northhorn 6,956
Mesaverde 8,744
Blue Castle Nelson 9,937
Blue Castle 10,230
Castlegate Buck Tongue 10,778
SEGO 10,928
Sunnyside 11,384
Kenilworth 11,661

35. ADDITIONALREMARW (include plu90 n0 procedure)

SEE ATTACHEDSHEET

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined ikom all available records.

NAME(PLEASE PRI ) Kaylene R. Gardner TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNAT
,

A I A A A DATE 12/15/2004

This report mu b submittedwithin 30 days of
• completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well
e drilling horizontal laterals from an existingwell bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
• recompleting to a different producing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphictests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from twoor more formations.

** ITEM24: Cement Top -Show how reported top(s)ofcement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey(TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple. Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
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ADDITIONAL REMARKS (CONTINUED):

27. PERFORATION RECORD
10,243-10,325 2 SPF
10,112-10,195 2 SPF

44. ACID, FRACTURE TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEFZE, ETC.
10,635-10,852 1298 BBLS GELLED WATER & 193,000 # 20/40 SAND
10,243-10,325 1035 BBLS GELLED WATER & 139,100 # 20/40 SAND
10,112-10,195 1092 BBLS GELLED WATER & 145,800 # 20/40 SAND

35. ADDITIONAL REMARKS

Perforated the Sunnyside 11,391-93', 11,406-09', 11,433-34', 11,462-63', 11,485-87' & 11,503-05' w/2
SPF.
Perforated the Blackhawk 11,122-25', 11,153-55', 11,229-30', 11,249-50', 11,274-76' & 11,289-91' w/2
SPF.
Perforated the Castlegate from 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10988-90', 11,031-32' & 11,065-66'
w/2 SPF.
Perforated the Nelson from 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52' w/2
SPF.
Perforated the Blue Castle from 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14', & 10,323-25'
w/2 SPF.
Perforated theBlue Castle from 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22', 10,178-80', 10,185-88' & 10,193-95'
w/2

O . O
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ois e o
eog resources

EOG Resources, Inc.
600 Seventeenth Street
Suito 1100N
Denver CO 80202
(303) 572-9000

Fax: (303) 824-5400

February 3, 2005

Utah Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple.
Vernal, UT 84078

RE: State 1-32 /ý 72 3Fff3¶T10S-R18E-Sec. 32
Uintah County, Utah

Ms.Carol Daniels:

Enclosed herewith are the following logs and data associated with the subject well:

/State 1-32
eservoir Saturation Tool GR 08-16-04 (2)

- rray Induction WILinear Correlation GR 08-27-04 (2)
Platform Express Compensated Neutron Three Detector Density 08-27-04 (2)

a/Microlog GR 08-27-04 (2)
//Dipole Shear Sonic Imager GR 08-27-04 (2)
/ Mechanical Sidewall Coring Tool GR 08-28-04 (2)

Ifyou have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me. RECEIVED
FEBO9 2005Very truly yours,

DNOFOIL,GAS MININGEOG RESOURCES, INC.

Delores Montoya
Exploration & Operations Secretary
Denver Office

Enc.12
cc: Well File

energy opportunity
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JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Governor

,
GARY R. HERBERT

-..9,•,•,, Lieutenant Governor

State of Utah March 29, 2006

Department of
Natural Resources

MICHAEL R. STYLER
Executive Director

CERTIFIED MAIL NO. 7005 0390 0000 7506 4727
Division of

Oil, Gas & Mining

JOHN R. BAZA Mr. R.G. Davis
Division Director EOG Resources Inc.

600 17thStreet, Suite 1100N
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: Extended Shut-in and Temporarily Abandoned Well Requirements for
Fee or State Leases.

Dear Mr. Davis:

As of March 2006, EOG Resources Inc. has one (1) State Lease Well (see
attachment A) that is in non-compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in or
temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status. Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive
months require the filing of a Sundry Notice in accordance with R649-3-36-1 for Utah
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining ("Division") approval. Wells with five (5) years non-

activity or non-productivity shall be plugged, unless the Division grants approval for
extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by the operator (R649-3-36-1.3.3).

For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the Division with

the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2).

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well
has integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition,

static fluid level, pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources
of Drinking Water and other factors do not make the well a risk to public
health and safety or the environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 •facsimile (801) 359-3940 •TTY (801) 538-7458 •
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Page 2
Mr. R.G. Davis
March 29, 2006

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and
may help qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in
violation of the SI/TA rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-
1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram.

2. Copy of recent casing pressure test.

3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and
casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity.

4. Fluid level in the wellbore.

5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this
notice, further actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this
matter, please contact me at (801) 538-5281.

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD:mf
Attachment
cc: Well File

Compliance File
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name Location API Lease Type Years inactive

1 State 1-32 SENW Sec 32-T10S-R18E 43-047-35839 State 1 Year 4

ATTACHMENT A

Well Name Location API Lease Type Years inactive

1 State 1-32 SENW Sec 32-T10S-R18E 43-047-35839 State 1 Year 4

ATTACHMENT A

Well Name Location API Lease Type Years inactive

1 State 1-32 SENW Sec 32-T10S-R18E 43-047-35839 State 1 Year 4



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

UT ST ML-48380
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1.TYPEOF\NELL 8.\NELLNAMEandNUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER State 1-32

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-047-35839

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. F1ELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N Denver CO 80202 (303) 824-5526 Wildcat
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL & 2067' FWL 39.901869 LAT109.918583 LON COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUB1NGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was turned to sales on 7/21/2006. Please see the attached operations summary report for drillingand
completion operations performed on the subject well.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Mary A. Maestas

SIGNATURE D

TLEE Operations Clerk

(This space for State use only)

JUL28 2006
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

UT ST ML-48380
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1.TYPEOF\NELL 8.\NELLNAMEandNUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER State 1-32

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-047-35839

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. F1ELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N Denver CO 80202 (303) 824-5526 Wildcat
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL & 2067' FWL 39.901869 LAT109.918583 LON COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUB1NGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was turned to sales on 7/21/2006. Please see the attached operations summary report for drillingand
completion operations performed on the subject well.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Mary A. Maestas

SIGNATURE D

TLEE Operations Clerk

(This space for State use only)

JUL28 2006
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

UT ST ML-48380
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1.TYPEOF\NELL 8.\NELLNAMEandNUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER State 1-32

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-047-35839

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. F1ELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N Denver CO 80202 (303) 824-5526 Wildcat
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL & 2067' FWL 39.901869 LAT109.918583 LON COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUB1NGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was turned to sales on 7/21/2006. Please see the attached operations summary report for drillingand
completion operations performed on the subject well.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Mary A. Maestas

SIGNATURE D

TLEE Operations Clerk

(This space for State use only)

JUL28 2006
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 07-26-2006

Well Name STATE 01-32 WellType EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIG SPRING API # 43-047-35839 Well Class 1SA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date 07-21-2006

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/ 11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/5,571

Location Section 32,T10S, RISE, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total 2,108,600 DHC / CWC 1,340,000/768,600

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-23-2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW)

SECTION 32, T105, R18E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

LAT 39.901869, LONG 109.918583

TD: 11,700' BLACKHAWK

TRUE RIG #9

WC/GAS

BIG SPRING PROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML-48380

ELEVATION: 5572' NAT GL, 5571' PREP GL, 5585' KB (14')

EOG WI 50%, NRI 43.75%

DOMINION EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIE TRGITER

DailyCosts: Drilling $65,464 Completion $0 Daily Total $65,464

Cum Costs: Drilling $65,464 Completion $0 Well Total $65,464

JUL28

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 07-26-2006

Well Name STATE 01-32 WellType EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIG SPRING API # 43-047-35839 Well Class 1SA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date 07-21-2006

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/ 11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/5,571

Location Section 32,T10S, RISE, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total 2,108,600 DHC / CWC 1,340,000/768,600

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-23-2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW)

SECTION 32, T105, R18E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

LAT 39.901869, LONG 109.918583

TD: 11,700' BLACKHAWK

TRUE RIG #9

WC/GAS

BIG SPRING PROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML-48380

ELEVATION: 5572' NAT GL, 5571' PREP GL, 5585' KB (14')

EOG WI 50%, NRI 43.75%

DOMINION EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIE TRGITER

DailyCosts: Drilling $65,464 Completion $0 Daily Total $65,464

Cum Costs: Drilling $65,464 Completion $0 Well Total $65,464

JUL28

WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 07-26-2006

Well Name STATE 01-32 WellType EXPG Division DENVER

Field BIG SPRING API # 43-047-35839 Well Class 1SA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 08-12-2004 Class Date 07-21-2006

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 11,700/ 11,700 Property # 055517

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,585/5,571

Location Section 32,T10S, RISE, SENW, 2152 FNL & 2067 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 50.0 NRI % 43.75

AFE No 303005 AFE Total 2,108,600 DHC / CWC 1,340,000/768,600

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE #9 Start Date 07-23-2004 Release Date 08-30-2004

07-23-2004 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW)

SECTION 32, T105, R18E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

LAT 39.901869, LONG 109.918583

TD: 11,700' BLACKHAWK

TRUE RIG #9

WC/GAS

BIG SPRING PROSPECT

LEASE: UT ST ML-48380

ELEVATION: 5572' NAT GL, 5571' PREP GL, 5585' KB (14')

EOG WI 50%, NRI 43.75%

DOMINION EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION, INC. WI 50%

08-11-2004 Reported By EDDIE TRGITER

DailyCosts: Drilling $65,464 Completion $0 Daily Total $65,464

Cum Costs: Drilling $65,464 Completion $0 Well Total $65,464

JUL28



Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17? "HOLE @ 3:00 PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED 17 1/2" HOLE TO 230'. RAN 5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#lFT, H-40, ST&C CASING & LANDED @
238.90' KB. RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. PRESSURETESTED LINESAND CEMENT VALVE TO 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED20 BBLS GELLED WATER & 20 BBLSWATER FLUSH AHEADOF CEMENT. MIXED & PUMPED 225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENT W/2% CACL2 & ?#/SX FLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15

CFISX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT WI29 BBLS WATER & SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. HAD 12 BBLS

CEMENT RETURNSTO SURFACE. RD BIG 4. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP

FROM REPORTUNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

ED TROTTER NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELSW/UOGM OF SPUDDING WELL AT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $180,789 Completion $0 Daily Total $180,789

Cum Costs: Drilling $246,253 Completion $0 WellTotal $246,253

MD 1,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRU TRUE RIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER, HCR AND HOOK UP CHOKE LINES.

13:30 14:30 1.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHP51 BIT, 5/6 LOBE 4 STAGE MOTOR, SHOCK SUB AND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP 214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 229' TO 285' (56') 56'lHR. 18/20K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 285' TO 350' (65') 65'lHR. 20/22KWOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588' (238') 47.6'lHR. 22/25K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @503', 3/4 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL RUTATE 588' TO 1005' (417') 69.5'lHR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIG ON DAY WORK 10:00 AM, 8/12/04

NUTIFIED UTAH DNR (CARROL DANIELS) OF INTENT TO SPUD @ 08:30 8/12/04

FUEL AT START OF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETY MEETING: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNINGSLICKLINE SURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 12 1/4" HOLE AT 3:30 PM, 8/12/04

08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $40,866 Completion $0 Daily Total $40,866

Cum Costs: Drilling $287,119 Completion $0 Well Total $287,119

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17? "HOLE @ 3:00 PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED 17 1/2" HOLE TO 230'. RAN 5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#lFT, H-40, ST&C CASING & LANDED @
238.90' KB. RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. PRESSURETESTED LINESAND CEMENT VALVE TO 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED20 BBLS GELLED WATER & 20 BBLSWATER FLUSH AHEADOF CEMENT. MIXED & PUMPED 225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENT W/2% CACL2 & ?#/SX FLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15

CFISX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT WI29 BBLS WATER & SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. HAD 12 BBLS

CEMENT RETURNSTO SURFACE. RD BIG 4. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP

FROM REPORTUNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

ED TROTTER NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELSW/UOGM OF SPUDDING WELL AT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $180,789 Completion $0 Daily Total $180,789

Cum Costs: Drilling $246,253 Completion $0 WellTotal $246,253

MD 1,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRU TRUE RIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER, HCR AND HOOK UP CHOKE LINES.

13:30 14:30 1.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHP51 BIT, 5/6 LOBE 4 STAGE MOTOR, SHOCK SUB AND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP 214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 229' TO 285' (56') 56'lHR. 18/20K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 285' TO 350' (65') 65'lHR. 20/22KWOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588' (238') 47.6'lHR. 22/25K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @503', 3/4 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL RUTATE 588' TO 1005' (417') 69.5'lHR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIG ON DAY WORK 10:00 AM, 8/12/04

NUTIFIED UTAH DNR (CARROL DANIELS) OF INTENT TO SPUD @ 08:30 8/12/04

FUEL AT START OF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETY MEETING: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNINGSLICKLINE SURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 12 1/4" HOLE AT 3:30 PM, 8/12/04

08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $40,866 Completion $0 Daily Total $40,866

Cum Costs: Drilling $287,119 Completion $0 Well Total $287,119

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

MD 230 TVD 230 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIG'S AIR RIG. SPUDDED 17? "HOLE @ 3:00 PM, 8/7/04.

DRILLED 17 1/2" HOLE TO 230'. RAN 5 JTS (224.40') OF 13-3/8", 48.0#lFT, H-40, ST&C CASING & LANDED @
238.90' KB. RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. PRESSURETESTED LINESAND CEMENT VALVE TO 1000 PSIG. MIXED &
PUMPED20 BBLS GELLED WATER & 20 BBLSWATER FLUSH AHEADOF CEMENT. MIXED & PUMPED 225
SX CLASS "G" CEMENT W/2% CACL2 & ?#/SX FLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15

CFISX (47.2 BBLS). DISPLACED CEMENT WI29 BBLS WATER & SHUT-IN CASING VALVE. HAD 12 BBLS

CEMENT RETURNSTO SURFACE. RD BIG 4. PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARY RIG. WORT. WILL DROP

FROM REPORTUNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

ED TROTTER NOTIFIED CAROL DANIELSW/UOGM OF SPUDDING WELL AT 1:00 PM, 8/7/04.

08-13-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $180,789 Completion $0 Daily Total $180,789

Cum Costs: Drilling $246,253 Completion $0 WellTotal $246,253

MD 1,005 TVD 1,005 Progress 766 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:00 4.0 MIRU TRUE RIG #9.

10:00 13:30 3.5 NU BOP/DIVERTER, HCR AND HOOK UP CHOKE LINES.

13:30 14:30 1.0 PICK UP 12 1/4" EHP51 BIT, 5/6 LOBE 4 STAGE MOTOR, SHOCK SUB AND DC'S TO TOP OF CEMENT AT214'.

14:30 15:30 1.0 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIP 214' TO 239'.

15:30 16:30 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 229' TO 285' (56') 56'lHR. 18/20K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

16:30 17:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 235', 1-1/4 DEG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

17:00 18:00 1.0 DRILL ROTATE 285' TO 350' (65') 65'lHR. 20/22KWOB, 145 BIT RPM.

18:00 18:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG.

18:30 23:30 5.0 DRILL ROTATE 350' TO 588' (238') 47.6'lHR. 22/25K WOB, 145 BIT RPM.

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @503', 3/4 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL RUTATE 588' TO 1005' (417') 69.5'lHR. 38/40K WOB, 157 BIT RPM.

RIG ON DAY WORK 10:00 AM, 8/12/04

NUTIFIED UTAH DNR (CARROL DANIELS) OF INTENT TO SPUD @ 08:30 8/12/04

FUEL AT START OF JOB 2200 GAL.

SAFETY MEETING: PICKINGUP COLLARS,RUNNINGSLICKLINE SURVEYS.

06:00 18.0 SPUD 12 1/4" HOLE AT 3:30 PM, 8/12/04

08-14-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $40,866 Completion $0 Daily Total $40,866

Cum Costs: Drilling $287,119 Completion $0 Well Total $287,119

MD 2,260 TVD 2,260 Progress 1,255 Days 2 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1005' TO 1117' (112') 74.6'IHR, 38/40K WOB, 155 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 1048', 3/4 DEG.

08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1117' TO 1365'(248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45K WOB, 127 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

I1:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE 1365' TO 1610' (245') 61.2'lHR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 1540', 2 1/2 DEG.

15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL & ROTATE1610' TO 1927' (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 1843', 2 3/4 DEG.

22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1927' TO 2260' (333') 44.4'lHR, 45/48K WOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:REPAIR PUMP/WORKINGWITH NEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY

TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS

BGG-72, CG-378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $33,756 Completion $0 Daily Total $33,756

Cum Costs: Drilling $320,875 Completion $0 Well Total $320,875

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHORT TRIP PRIOR TO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2260' TO 2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 2300', 1 1/4 DEG.

08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.5'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

11:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2457' TO 2865' (408') 45.3'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 2780', 2 DEG.

20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 2865' TO 3200' (335') 44.6'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSINGWATER AT ?3000',
LOST TUTAL OF 640 BBLS EST.

04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 3113', 1 DEG.

04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIP TO DRILL COLLARS. HOLE TAKING 2 TIMES NORMAL FILL.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNINGFORK LIFT, WIRE LINE SURVEYS

TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 20% SH, 35% SS, 45% LS

BGG 34, CG 43

08-16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $136,594 Completion $0 Daily Total $136,594
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1005' TO 1117' (112') 74.6'IHR, 38/40K WOB, 155 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 1048', 3/4 DEG.

08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1117' TO 1365'(248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45K WOB, 127 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

I1:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE 1365' TO 1610' (245') 61.2'lHR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 1540', 2 1/2 DEG.

15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL & ROTATE1610' TO 1927' (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 1843', 2 3/4 DEG.

22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1927' TO 2260' (333') 44.4'lHR, 45/48K WOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:REPAIR PUMP/WORKINGWITH NEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY

TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS

BGG-72, CG-378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $33,756 Completion $0 Daily Total $33,756

Cum Costs: Drilling $320,875 Completion $0 Well Total $320,875

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHORT TRIP PRIOR TO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2260' TO 2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 2300', 1 1/4 DEG.

08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.5'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

11:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2457' TO 2865' (408') 45.3'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 2780', 2 DEG.

20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 2865' TO 3200' (335') 44.6'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSINGWATER AT ?3000',
LOST TUTAL OF 640 BBLS EST.

04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 3113', 1 DEG.

04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIP TO DRILL COLLARS. HOLE TAKING 2 TIMES NORMAL FILL.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNINGFORK LIFT, WIRE LINE SURVEYS

TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 20% SH, 35% SS, 45% LS

BGG 34, CG 43

08-16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $136,594 Completion $0 Daily Total $136,594
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1005' TO 1117' (112') 74.6'IHR, 38/40K WOB, 155 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 1048', 3/4 DEG.

08:00 10:30 2.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1117' TO 1365'(248') 99.2'lHR, 38/45K WOB, 127 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

I1:00 15:00 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE 1365' TO 1610' (245') 61.2'lHR, 40/45K WOB, 130 RPM.

15:00 15:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 1540', 2 1/2 DEG.

15:30 22:00 6.5 DRILL & ROTATE1610' TO 1927' (317') 48.7'/HR, 45/48K WOB, 130RPM.

22:00 22:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 1843', 2 3/4 DEG.

22:30 06:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 1927' TO 2260' (333') 44.4'lHR, 45/48K WOB, 130 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING:REPAIR PUMP/WORKINGWITH NEW HANDS/WIRELINE SURVEY

TEMP 58 DEG

FORMATION: 40% SH, 15% SS, 55% LS

BGG-72, CG-378

08-15-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $33,756 Completion $0 Daily Total $33,756

Cum Costs: Drilling $320,875 Completion $0 Well Total $320,875

MD 3,200 TVD 3,200 Progress 940 Days 3 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SHORT TRIP PRIOR TO LOG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2260' TO 2370' (110') 55'/HR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

08:00 08:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 2300', 1 1/4 DEG.

08:30 10:30 2.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2370' TO 2457' (87') 43.5'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

10:30 11:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TEST DIVERTER.

11:00 20:00 9.0 DRILL & ROTATE 2457' TO 2865' (408') 45.3'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

20:00 20:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 2780', 2 DEG.

20:30 04:00 7.5 DRILL & ROTATE 2865' TO 3200' (335') 44.6'lHR, 48/52K WOB, 45/82 RPM. STARTED LOSINGWATER AT ?3000',
LOST TUTAL OF 640 BBLS EST.

04:00 04:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 3113', 1 DEG.

04:30 05:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH LCM SWEEP.

05:00 06:00 1.0 WIPER TRIP/SHORT TRIP TO DRILL COLLARS. HOLE TAKING 2 TIMES NORMAL FILL.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNINGFORK LIFT, WIRE LINE SURVEYS

TEMP 52 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 20% SH, 35% SS, 45% LS

BGG 34, CG 43

08-16-2004 Reported By BRUCETAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $136,594 Completion $0 Daily Total $136,594
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Cum Costs: Drilling $457,469 Completion $0 Well Total $457,469

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE, NO FILL, NO DRAG.

07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BUITOMS UP, CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILL ADDITIONAL 89' DUE TO DRILL BREAKS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3225' TO 3314'(89') 25.4'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE. CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.

12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED DIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'lHR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATE BUTTOMSUP. SPOT 75 BBLS LCM PILL ON BUITOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE. LAID DOWN 3 - 8" COLLARS, MOTOR AND SHOCK SUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELD PRE-JOB SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASING AS FOLLOWS: GUIDE SHOE, 1 FLOAT
JOINT, FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RANTUTAL OF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASING SHOE
LANDEDAT3400', FLOATCOLLARAT3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS5' ABOVESHOE,FIRST JOINT,NEXT JT,
THEN EVERY 5TH JT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOM OF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUG RETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCH TO SCHLUMBERGER, LEAD W/285 SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12% D20, 1% D79, .25% D112, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0 PPG, YIELD 3.91. TAIL WITH 320 SXS "G" W/10% D53, 2% S1, .25 PPS D29, MIXED AT
14.2 PPG YIELD 1.61. DROPPEDPLUG AND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLS WATER, DID NOT BUMP PLUG, HAD
FULL RETURNSTHROUGH OUT JOB WITH 50 BBLS CEMENT TO SURFACE. RELEASE PSI, FLOAT EQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER, SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSG WITH 98K STRING WT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUE ND DIVERTER AND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING: OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NOTIFIED UTAHDOG&M OF INTENT TO SETAND CEMENT INTERMEDIATE CASING (LEFT CAROL
DANIELS A MESSAGE) AT 09:30 AM, 8/15/04

RECIEVED 73 JTS 9 5/8" CASING FROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TOTAL PIPE ON LOCATION
3451'

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,712 Completion $0 Daily Total $29,712

Cum Costs: Drilling $487,182 Completion $0 Well Total $487,182

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINAL CUT ON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Cum Costs: Drilling $457,469 Completion $0 Well Total $457,469

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE, NO FILL, NO DRAG.

07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BUITOMS UP, CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILL ADDITIONAL 89' DUE TO DRILL BREAKS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3225' TO 3314'(89') 25.4'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE. CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.

12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED DIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'lHR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATE BUTTOMSUP. SPOT 75 BBLS LCM PILL ON BUITOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE. LAID DOWN 3 - 8" COLLARS, MOTOR AND SHOCK SUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELD PRE-JOB SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASING AS FOLLOWS: GUIDE SHOE, 1 FLOAT

JOINT, FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RANTUTAL OF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASING SHOE

LANDEDAT3400', FLOATCOLLARAT3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS5' ABOVESHOE,FIRST JOINT,NEXT JT,
THEN EVERY 5TH JT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOM OF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUG RETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCH TO SCHLUMBERGER, LEAD W/285 SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12% D20, 1% D79, .25% D112, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0 PPG, YIELD 3.91. TAIL WITH 320 SXS "G" W/10% D53, 2% S1, .25 PPS D29, MIXED AT
14.2 PPG YIELD 1.61. DROPPEDPLUG AND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLS WATER, DID NOT BUMP PLUG, HAD
FULL RETURNSTHROUGH OUT JOB WITH 50 BBLS CEMENT TO SURFACE. RELEASE PSI, FLOAT EQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER, SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSG WITH 98K STRING WT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUE ND DIVERTER AND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING: OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NOTIFIED UTAHDOG&M OF INTENT TO SETAND CEMENT INTERMEDIATE CASING (LEFT CAROL
DANIELS A MESSAGE) AT 09:30 AM, 8/15/04

RECIEVED 73 JTS 9 5/8" CASING FROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TOTAL PIPE ON LOCATION

3451'

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,712 Completion $0 Daily Total $29,712

Cum Costs: Drilling $487,182 Completion $0 Well Total $487,182

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINAL CUT ON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Cum Costs: Drilling $457,469 Completion $0 Well Total $457,469

MD 3,400 TVD 3,400 Progress 200 Days 4 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ND DIVERTER

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 FINISH WIPER TRIP TO COLLARS. TRIP IN HOLE, NO FILL, NO DRAG.

07:00 07:30 0.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3200' TO 3225' (25') 50'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CIRCULATED BUITOMS UP, CHANGE OF SCOPE. DRILL ADDITIONAL 89' DUE TO DRILL BREAKS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE 3225' TO 3314'(89') 25.4'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 CIRCULATE. CHANGE OF SCOPE, DRIL ADDITIONAL 86'.

12:00 13:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3314' TO 3358' (44') 44'/HR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED DIVERTER.

13:30 14:30 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3358' TO 3400' (42') 42'lHR, 48/50K WOB, 45/82 RPM.

14:30 15:00 0.5 CIRCULATE BUTTOMSUP. SPOT 75 BBLS LCM PILL ON BUITOM.

15:00 16:30 1.5 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO RUN CASING.

16:30 17:30 1.0 RIG UP LAY DOWN MACHINE. LAID DOWN 3 - 8" COLLARS, MOTOR AND SHOCK SUB.

17:30 23:00 5.5 HELD PRE-JOB SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP AND RUN 9 5/8" CASING AS FOLLOWS: GUIDE SHOE, 1 FLOAT

JOINT, FLOAT COLLAR, 76 JTS CASING. RANTUTAL OF 77 JTS 9 5/8", 36#, J-55, STC CASING,CASING SHOE

LANDEDAT3400', FLOATCOLLARAT3353'. RAN CENTRALIZERS5' ABOVESHOE,FIRST JOINT,NEXT JT,
THEN EVERY 5TH JT. TACK WELDED SHOE & TOP AND BOTTOM OF FLOAT COLLAR.

23:00 00:00 1.0 INSTALLED PLUG RETAINER. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP WITH RIG.

00:00 03:00 3.0 SWITCH TO SCHLUMBERGER, LEAD W/285 SXS "G" WITH 5% D44, 12% D20, 1% D79, .25% D112, .2% D46, .25

PPS D29, MIXED AT 11.0 PPG, YIELD 3.91. TAIL WITH 320 SXS "G" W/10% D53, 2% S1, .25 PPS D29, MIXED AT
14.2 PPG YIELD 1.61. DROPPEDPLUG AND DISPLACED WITH 260 BBLS WATER, DID NOT BUMP PLUG, HAD
FULL RETURNSTHROUGH OUT JOB WITH 50 BBLS CEMENT TO SURFACE. RELEASE PSI, FLOAT EQUIP,
HELD. RDMO SCHLUMBERGER.

03:00 04:00 1.0 ND DIVERTER, SET SLIPS ON 9 5/8" CSG WITH 98K STRING WT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 CONTINUE ND DIVERTER AND REMOVE FROM UNDER FLOOR.

SAFETY MEETING: OIL SPILLS AND LEAKS/TRIPPING

NOTIFIED UTAHDOG&M OF INTENT TO SETAND CEMENT INTERMEDIATE CASING (LEFT CAROL
DANIELS A MESSAGE) AT 09:30 AM, 8/15/04

RECIEVED 73 JTS 9 5/8" CASING FROM BUNNING & 5 JTS FROM VERNAL YARD, TOTAL PIPE ON LOCATION

3451'

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 35% SH, 25% SS, 10% SLTST, 30% LS

08-17-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $29,712 Completion $0 Daily Total $29,712

Cum Costs: Drilling $487,182 Completion $0 Well Total $487,182

MD 4,115 TVD 4,115 Progress 715 Days 5 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 MAKE FINAL CUT ON 9 5/8". INSTALLED "B" SECTION AND TESTED SAME TO 1800 PSI.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOG WITH SCHLUMBERGER WHILE NU BOP'S.

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTED BLIND RAMS,PIPE RAMS,FLOOR VALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATED VALVESTO 250 & 5000 PSI.
TESTED HYDRIL 250 & 2500 PSI WITH B&C QUICK TEST, ALL TESTS 10 MINUTES. TESTED CASING TO 1500
PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEAR BUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKEUP HYCALOGDSX2l0 JETTED .85 TFA ON A HUNTING7/8 LOBE 2.9 STAGE MUTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLE WITH SAME TO TOP OF CEMENT.

19:00 20:30 1.5 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10' NEW HOLE TO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FIT TEST TO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENT WITH 8.4 PPG WATER IN HOLE AND 690 PSI. APPLIED PSI,
HELD FOR 15 MIN, OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE W/MUTOR 3410' TO 3680' (270') 77.1'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 3598', 1/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3680' TO 4115' (435') 87'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTINGINU BOP/CUT DRILL LINE

TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST, 35% LS

BGG 34, CG 83, HG 465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $28,455 Completion $0 Daily Total $28,455

Cum Costs: Drilling $515,638 Completion $0 Well Total $515,638

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE WIMOTOR 4115' TO 4198' (83') 83'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 4198' TO 4668' (470') 94'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY@4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL & ROTATE 4668' TO 5175' (507') 92.1'lHR, 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 5095', 1 1/2 DEG.

19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL & RUTATE 5175' TO 6040'(865') 78.6'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:SLINGINGPIPE FROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROM V-DOOR/SLICKLINE SURVEYS/BOP

DRILL 1 MIN 40 SEC

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH @ 4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15% SLTST, 5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $23,552 Completion $0 Daily Total $23,552

Cum Costs: Drilling $539,190 Completion $0 Well Total $539,190

MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOG WITH SCHLUMBERGER WHILE NU BOP'S.

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTED BLIND RAMS,PIPE RAMS,FLOOR VALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATED VALVESTO 250 & 5000 PSI.
TESTED HYDRIL 250 & 2500 PSI WITH B&C QUICK TEST, ALL TESTS 10 MINUTES. TESTED CASING TO 1500
PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEAR BUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKEUP HYCALOGDSX2l0 JETTED .85 TFA ON A HUNTING7/8 LOBE 2.9 STAGE MUTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLE WITH SAME TO TOP OF CEMENT.

19:00 20:30 1.5 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10' NEW HOLE TO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FIT TEST TO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENT WITH 8.4 PPG WATER IN HOLE AND 690 PSI. APPLIED PSI,
HELD FOR 15 MIN, OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE W/MUTOR 3410' TO 3680' (270') 77.1'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 3598', 1/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3680' TO 4115' (435') 87'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTINGINU BOP/CUT DRILL LINE

TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST, 35% LS

BGG 34, CG 83, HG 465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $28,455 Completion $0 Daily Total $28,455

Cum Costs: Drilling $515,638 Completion $0 Well Total $515,638

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE WIMOTOR 4115' TO 4198' (83') 83'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 4198' TO 4668' (470') 94'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY@4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL & ROTATE 4668' TO 5175' (507') 92.1'lHR, 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 5095', 1 1/2 DEG.

19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL & RUTATE 5175' TO 6040'(865') 78.6'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:SLINGINGPIPE FROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROM V-DOOR/SLICKLINE SURVEYS/BOP

DRILL 1 MIN 40 SEC

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH @ 4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15% SLTST, 5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $23,552 Completion $0 Daily Total $23,552

Cum Costs: Drilling $539,190 Completion $0 Well Total $539,190

MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

07:30 12:00 4.5 NU BOP'S. RAN RST LOG WITH SCHLUMBERGER WHILE NU BOP'S.

12:00 16:00 4.0 TESTED BLIND RAMS,PIPE RAMS,FLOOR VALVES,CHOKE AND ALL RELATED VALVESTO 250 & 5000 PSI.
TESTED HYDRIL 250 & 2500 PSI WITH B&C QUICK TEST, ALL TESTS 10 MINUTES. TESTED CASING TO 1500
PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.

16:00 17:00 1.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.

17:00 17:30 0.5 INSTALLEDWEAR BUSHING.

17:30 19:00 1.5 MAKEUP HYCALOGDSX2l0 JETTED .85 TFA ON A HUNTING7/8 LOBE 2.9 STAGE MUTOR AND BHA. TRIP
IN HOLE WITH SAME TO TOP OF CEMENT.

19:00 20:30 1.5 DRILL CEMENT & FLOAT EQUIPMENT. DRILL 10' NEW HOLE TO 3410'. CIRC 5 MIN.

20:30 21:00 0.5 PERFORMED FIT TEST TO 12.3 PPG EQUIVALENT WITH 8.4 PPG WATER IN HOLE AND 690 PSI. APPLIED PSI,
HELD FOR 15 MIN, OK. BLED TO "O".

21:00 00:30 3.5 DRILL & ROTATE W/MUTOR 3410' TO 3680' (270') 77.1'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

00:30 01:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 3598', 1/4 DEG.

01:00 06:00 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 3680' TO 4115' (435') 87'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CEMENTINGINU BOP/CUT DRILL LINE

TEMP 63 DEG

FORMATION: GREEN RIVER 30% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST, 35% LS

BGG 34, CG 83, HG 465

08-18-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $28,455 Completion $0 Daily Total $28,455

Cum Costs: Drilling $515,638 Completion $0 Well Total $515,638

MD 6,040 TVD 6,040 Progress 1,925 Days 6 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE WIMOTOR 4115' TO 4198' (83') 83'lHR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @4133', 1 DEG.

07:30 12:30 5.0 DRILL & ROTATE 4198' TO 4668' (470') 94'/HR, 18K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 250 DIFF.

12:30 13:00 0.5 SURVEY@4600', 1 1/4 DEG.

13:00 18:30 5.5 DRILL & ROTATE 4668' TO 5175' (507') 92.1'lHR, 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

18:30 19:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 5095', 1 1/2 DEG.

19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILL & RUTATE 5175' TO 6040'(865') 78.6'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING:SLINGINGPIPE FROM TUBS/PICKINGUP DP FROM V-DOOR/SLICKLINE SURVEYS/BOP

DRILL 1 MIN 40 SEC

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: WASATCH @ 4124', 55% SH, 25% SS, 15% SLTST, 5% LS

08-19-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $23,552 Completion $0 Daily Total $23,552

Cum Costs: Drilling $539,190 Completion $0 Well Total $539,190

MD 7,470 TVD 7,470 Progress 1,430 Days 7 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE W/MUTOR6040' TO 6146' (106') 106'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF. BOP DRILL

l MIN, 40 SEC.

07:00 07:30 0.5 SURVEY @ 6064', 1 3/4 DEG.

07:30 11:30 4.0 DRILL & ROTATE 6146' TO 6451' (305') 76.2'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTESTED HYDRILL, FLOOR VALVES & CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC. BOP DRILL

DAYS 1 MIN, 50 SEC.

12:00 23:30 11.5 DRILL RUTATE 6451' TO 7131' (680') 59.1'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFE

23:30 00:00 0.5 SURVEY @ 7089', 2 DEG.

00:00 06:00 6.0 DRILL & ROTATE7131' TO 7470' (339') 56.5'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 22/46 RPM, 150-250 DIFF.

SAFETY MEETING: CHANGING OIL/LOADINGAND UNLOADING/WORKING IN RAIN

TEMP 53 DEG

FORMATION: NORTH HORN @ 6300', 65% SH, 20% SS, 15% SLTST

08-20-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $26,685 Completion $0 Daily Total $26,685

Cum Costs: Drilling $565,876 Completion $0 Well Total $565,876

MD 8,384 TVD 8,384 Progress 914 Days 8 MW 8.6 Visc 32.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILL & RŒATE W/MOTOR7470' TO 7809' (339') 48.4'lHR, 18/22K WOB, 22/57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFF.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTESTED PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL & CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC.

13:30 06:00 16.5 DRILL & RŒATE 7809' TO 8384' (575') 34.8'/HR, 18/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100-150 DIFE

STARTED LIGHT MUD UP AT 7850'

SAFETY MEETING: MIXING CHEMICAL/WORKING ON PUMPS

TEMP 55 DEG

FORMATION: DARK CANYON TOP @ 8280', 79% SH, 20% SS, 10% SLTST

08-21-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $35,349 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,349

Cum Costs: Drilling $601,225 Completion $0 Well Total $601,225

MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 DRILL RUTATE 8384' TO 8429' (45') 22.5'/HR. 20/22K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 100 DIFE

08:00 12:00 4.0 SLUG,DROP SURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #3. HAD 10-15K DRAGON FIRST 5 STANDS,CLEAN

WITH NO DRAG AFTER THAT. SURVEY @ 8400'-2 DEG.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION TEST BLINDS, RAMS, CHOKE, FLOOR VALVES.

Page

Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILL & ROTATE W/MUTOR6040' TO 6146' (106') 106'lHR, 18/20K WOB, 57/46 RPM, 200-250 DIFF. BOP DRILL

l MIN, 40 SEC.
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DailyCosts: Drilling $35,349 Completion $0 Daily Total $35,349

Cum Costs: Drilling $601,225 Completion $0 Well Total $601,225

MD 9,090 TVD 9,090 Progress 706 Days 9 MW 8.9 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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WITH NO DRAG AFTER THAT. SURVEY @ 8400'-2 DEG.

12:00 12:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG. FUNCTION TEST BLINDS, RAMS, CHOKE, FLOOR VALVES.
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Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

12:30 16:00 3.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 - HTC HC506Z JETTED WITH 0.66" TFA. PU 2 - 3 PT. ROLLER REAMERS(ONEAT 30' &
OTHER AT 60') WITH 1/16" UNDERGAUGE BUTTON CUTTERSON EACH, TRIP IN HOLE WITH SAME.

16:00 16:30 0.5 WASH/REAM 30' OF FILL ON BOTTOM. PATTERN BIT.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL 8429' TO 9090' (661') 48.9'lHR. 28/30K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNING WATER AROUND ELECTICAL OUTLETS, TRIPPING, IMPORTANCE OF USING
STATICLINE.

WEATHER: 58 DEG. PARTLY CLOUDY, CALM

FORMATION: PRICE RIVER TOP @ 8549', 40%SH, 50% SS, 10% SLTST.

BGG-30, CG-52, TG-41

08-22-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $28,292 Completion $0 Daily Total $28,292

Cum Costs: Drilling $629,517 Completion $0 Well Total $629,517

MD 10,195 TVD 10,195 Progress 1,105 Days 10 MW 9.8 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 9090' TO 9368' (278') 55.6'lHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SURVEY @ 9326' - 2 1/4 DEG.

12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL 9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. RAISE WT. TO 9.5 PPG AT 9400'

17:00 17:30 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

17:30 18:00 0.5 CHANGE OUT ROTATING HEAD INSERT AND FLOW SENSOR.

18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL 9675' TO 10195' (520') 43.3'lHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10 PPG PRIOR TO THE
BLUECASTLE FORMATION.

SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.

WEATHER 53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @ 3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @ 9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST, 20% CARB SH.

BGG 3747, CG 1306,HIGH GAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $23,239 Completion $0 Daily Total $23,239

Cum Costs: Drilling $652,757 Completion $0 WellTotal $652,757

MD 10,290 TVD 10,290 Progress 95 Days 11 MW 10.5 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227' TO 10250' (23') 5.l'lHR. 14/30K WOB. 58 RPM.

12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG, DROP SURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #4. BIT WORN FLAT ON SHOULDER TO MATRIX. INNER
CUTTERS IN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX146HGJWAND TRIP IN HOLE TO CASING SHOE.

20:00 22:00 2.0 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517
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18:00 06:00 12.0 DRILL 9675' TO 10195' (520') 43.3'lHR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. INCR MW SLOWLY TO 10 PPG PRIOR TO THE
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SAFETY MEETING: HIGH PSI LINES, PPE, WIRE LINE SURVEYS.

WEATHER 53 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @ 3 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @ 9931', 40% SH, 30% SS, 10% SLTST, 20% CARB SH.

BGG 3747, CG 1306,HIGH GAS 5804.

08-23-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $23,239 Completion $0 Daily Total $23,239

Cum Costs: Drilling $652,757 Completion $0 WellTotal $652,757
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Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
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Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10195' TO 10227' (32') 21.3'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 SERVICE RIG, FUNCTION TEST HYDRIL, FLOOR VALVES.

08:00 12:30 4.5 DRILL 10227' TO 10250' (23') 5.l'lHR. 14/30K WOB. 58 RPM.

12:30 17:30 5.0 SLUG, DROP SURVEY, PULL OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT #4. BIT WORN FLAT ON SHOULDER TO MATRIX. INNER
CUTTERS IN GOOD SHAPE, 1/16" OUT OF GUAGE. FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAMS.

17:30 20:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #4, DSX146HGJWAND TRIP IN HOLE TO CASING SHOE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517
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12:00 17:00 5.0 DRILL 9368' TO 9675' (307') 61.4'/HR. 30K WOB, 58 RPM. RAISE WT. TO 9.5 PPG AT 9400'
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISH IN HOLE FILLINGPIPE EVERY 35 STANDS.

01:00 02:00 1.0 WASHIREAM 71' TO BUITOM SLOWLY.TORQUEY LAST 20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'lHR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CHAINS, HOSES, ETC. AROUND ROTARY TABLE, TRIPPINGAND CUTTING DRILL LINE.

WEATHER: 57 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @ 5 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @ 9931', 50% SH, 35% SS, 5 % SLTST, 10% CARB SH.

BGG 2353, CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280, HIGH GAS 5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $30,787 Completion $0 Daily Total $30,787

Cum Costs: Drilling $683,544 Completion $0 Well Total $683,544

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304' (14') 9.3'lHR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGED SWAB & SEAT IN PUMPS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304' TO 10,350' (46') 13.1'lHR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRIL & FLOORVALVES.

12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350' TO 10,708' (358') 19.8'lHR, 16/18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPINGlWORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 52?

FORMATION: LOWER PRICE RIVER @ 10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, 5% SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL

BGG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES >1'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,289 Completion $0 Daily Total $39,289

Cum Costs: Drilling $722,833 Completion $0 Well Total $722,833

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708' TO 10,846' (138') 27.6'/HR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL AND HCR.

11:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846' TO 11,046' (200') 10.8'/HR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG

TEMP 50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP @ 10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, 10% COAL

BGG 2799, CG 5849, HIGH GAS 4269
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISH IN HOLE FILLINGPIPE EVERY 35 STANDS.

01:00 02:00 1.0 WASHIREAM 71' TO BUITOM SLOWLY.TORQUEY LAST 20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'lHR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.
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BGG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES >1'
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DailyCosts: Drilling $39,289 Completion $0 Daily Total $39,289

Cum Costs: Drilling $722,833 Completion $0 Well Total $722,833

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708' TO 10,846' (138') 27.6'/HR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL AND HCR.

11:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846' TO 11,046' (200') 10.8'/HR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG

TEMP 50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP @ 10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, 10% COAL

BGG 2799, CG 5849, HIGH GAS 4269
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

22:00 01:00 3.0 FINISH IN HOLE FILLINGPIPE EVERY 35 STANDS.

01:00 02:00 1.0 WASHIREAM 71' TO BUITOM SLOWLY.TORQUEY LAST 20'.

02:00 06:00 4.0 DRILL 10250' TO 10290' (40') 10'lHR. 14K WOB, 58 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: CHAINS, HOSES, ETC. AROUND ROTARY TABLE, TRIPPINGAND CUTTING DRILL LINE.

WEATHER: 57 DEG, FAIR, WIND WEST @ 5 MPH.

FORMATION: BLUECASTLE TOP @ 9931', 50% SH, 35% SS, 5 % SLTST, 10% CARB SH.

BGG 2353, CG 5197, TRIP GAS 6280, HIGH GAS 5534.

08-24-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $30,787 Completion $0 Daily Total $30,787

Cum Costs: Drilling $683,544 Completion $0 Well Total $683,544

MD 10,708 TVD 10,708 Progress 418 Days 12 MW 10.6 Visc 42.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 DRILL 10,290' TO 10,304' (14') 9.3'lHR, 12/14K WOB, 58 RPM.

07:30 08:00 0.5 CHANGED SWAB & SEAT IN PUMPS.

08:00 11:30 3.5 DRILL 10,304' TO 10,350' (46') 13.1'lHR, 14/16K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED HYDRIL & FLOORVALVES.

12:00 06:00 18.0 DRILL 13,350' TO 10,708' (358') 19.8'lHR, 16/18KWOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPINGlWORKINGON PUMPS

TEMP 52?

FORMATION: LOWER PRICE RIVER @ 10,342', 25% SH, 20% SD, 5% SLTST, 45% CARB SH, 5% COAL

BGG 2454, CG 4672, HIGH GAS 4632, VERY SMALL FLARE AT TIMES >1'

08-25-2004 Reported By BRUCE TAYLOR

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,289 Completion $0 Daily Total $39,289

Cum Costs: Drilling $722,833 Completion $0 Well Total $722,833

MD 11,046 TVD 11,046 Progress 338 Days 13 MW 10.8 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILL 10,708' TO 10,846' (138') 27.6'/HR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS, HYDRIL AND HCR.

11:30 06:00 18.5 DRILL 10,846' TO 11,046' (200') 10.8'/HR, 18K WOB, 55 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: HOUSEKEEPING/ELECTRICAL REPAIR/UNLOADINGCSG

TEMP 50 DEG

FORMATION:CASTLEGATE TOP @ 10,873', 45% SH, 30% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, 10% COAL

BGG 2799, CG 5849, HIGH GAS 4269
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Well Name: STATE01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

08-26-2004 Reported By TAYLOR/CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling $27,209 Completion $0 Daily Total $27,209

Cum Costs: Drilling $750,042 Completion $0 Well Total $750,042

MD 11,160 TVD 11,155 Progress 114 Days 14 MW 10.8 Visc 45.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 17:00 11.0 DRILL l1,046' TO 11,146' (100') 9 FPH, 22K WOB, 57 RPM.

17:00 23:00 6.0 PUMPED SLUG. DROPPED SURVEY. TOH FOR BIT #5, NO TIGHT SPOTS. BIT IN GAUGE, INNER STRUCTURE

GOOD, WORN CUTTERSAND FLATTENED CUTTERS ON OUTSIDE.

23:00 05:00 6.0 MAKE UP BIT #5, HTC HC506Z AND TIH. WASHED & REAMED LAST 20' WITHOUT MUCH TORQUE.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL l1,146' TO 11,160' (14') 14 FPH, WOB 9-12K, 54 RPM.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: BLACKHAWK TOP @ 11,112', 35% SH, 50% SS, 5% SLTST, 10% CARB SH, COAL < 5%

BGG 2200, TRIP GAS 6000

08-27-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling $22,440 Completion $0 Daily Total $22,440

Cum Costs: Drilling $772,483 Completion $0 Well Total $772,483

MD 11,650 TVD 11,650 Progress 490 Days 15 MW 11.1 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 DRILL 11,160' TO 11,650'(490') 20 FPH, WOB 18K, 56 RPM, PP 1500 PSI.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT

FORMATION: SUNNYSIDE TOP @ 11,370', 20% SH, 65% SS, 10% SLTST, 5% CARB SH

BG GAS 3284U,CONN GAS 5154U

08-28-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling $19,829 Completion $0 Daily Total $19,829

Cum Costs: Drilling $792,312 Completion $0 Well Total $792,312

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 50 Days 16 MW 11.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN OPEN HOLE LOGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:30 3.5 DRILL 11650' - 11700' TD. REACHED TD @ 09:30, 8/27/04. (50') 17 FPH, WOB 19K, 56 RPM, PP 1550.

09:30 11:00 1.5 CIRCULATED FOR SHORT TRIP.

11:00 12:00 1.0 SHORT TRIP 15 STANDS, NO DRAG OR FILL.

12:00 14:00 2.0 CIRCULATED TRIP GAS OUT, 6900 UNITS. PUMPED PILL.

14:00 19:00 5.0 TOH FOR LOGS. SCHLUMBERGER ON LOCATION @ 17:00.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

19:00 06:00 11.0 SAFETYMEETING. RU SCHLUMBERGER. LOGGINGWELL. LOGS RUN: PLATFORM EXPRESSWITH
DIPOLE SONIC FROM TD TO BASEOF INT CASING. RUTARY SIDEWALL CORES IN NEXT RUNS.

SAFETY MEETING: LOGGING

08-29-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

Daily Costs: Drilling $22,451 Completion $0 Daily Total $22,451

Cum Costs: Drilling $814,764 Completion $0 Well Total $814,764

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FISHINGRUTARY CORING TOOL

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 LOGGINGWISCHLUMBERGER. FINISHED RUNNING PLATFORM EXPRESS & DIPOLESONIC,LOGGERSTD
WAS 11,706'.

07:00 09:00 2.0 WAIT ON ORDERS (CORE POINTS OFF OF LOGS). RECEIVED CORE POINTSFROM GEOLOGY DEPT.

09:00 12:00 3.0 TIH W/ROTARYSIDEWALL CORE TOOL, MADE ONE CORE @ l1,653' AND WASSTUCK.

12:00 17:00 5.0 WORKED TOOL, TRIED TO GET FREE WITH NO PROGRESS WHILE WAITING ON WEATHERFORD
FISHERMAN & TOOLS.

17:00 20:00 3.0 RUWEATHERFORD TO STRIP OVER WIRELINE AND FISH TOOL. SAFETYMEETING:DON'T GET IN A

HURRY.

20:00 01:00 5.0 TIH, STRIPPINGOVERWIRELINE,CAMELOOSE @4185'.

01:00 04:00 3.0 TIED WIRELINE TOGETHER AND PULLED TOOL INTO OVERSHUT.

04:00 06:00 2.0 PULLED LINE OUT OF TOOL AND POH W/ELECTRICCABLE.

SAFETY MEETING: CONTRACTORS ON LOCATION.

CONTACTED CAROL DANIELSWlUOGM AT 10:30 AM, 8/26/04 TO NOTIFYOF PRODUCTION CASING
CEMENT JOB.

DON PRESENKOWSKI CONTACTED DAN JARVIS(LEFT MESSAGE, NO AFTER-HOURS NUMBER) W/UTAH

DNR AT 11:30 AM, 8-27-04 W/NGTIFICATION OF CHANGE IN LEAD CEMENT, SLURRY & UPDATED TIMING
FOR PRODUCTION CEMENT JOB.

08-30-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling $107,269 Completion $0 Daily Total $107,269

Cum Costs: Drilling $922,033 Completion $0 Well Total $922,033

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LD DP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 TOH W/DP, FISHINGTOOLS & CORE TOOL (FISH). LD FISH.

09:00 10:00 1.0 BREAK DOWNFISHINGTOOLS, REMOVED WEAR BUSHING.

10:00 15:00 5.0 TIH W/TRI-CONE BIT TO CLEAN OUT AND CONDITIONE HOLE FOR CASING, 4' FILL.

15:00 17:00 2.0 CIRCULATED AND CONDITIONED HOLE FOR CASING.

17:00 02:00 9.0 SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP WESTATES CASING SERVICE. LAY DOWN DRILL PIPE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

02:00 06:00 4.0 RU WESTATES CASING TOOLS. SAFETY MEETING. RUN 4 1/2", 11.6#, P-110, LTC CASINGAS FOLLOWS:
FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, CASING. CENTRALIZERS ON MIDDLE FIRST JOINT, EVERY
OTHER JOINT TO 8800' (37 TOTAL). MARKER JOINTS @ 901l' AND 6336'. (4100' OF CASING PICKED UP @
REPORT TIME).

SAFETY MEETING: LD DRILL PIPE

08-31-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling $104,377 Completion $145,844 Daily Total $250,222

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $145,844 Well Total $1,172,255

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 FINISHED RUNNING TGTAL OF 293 JOINTS (291 FULL JTS + 2 - 20' MARKER JOINTS)OF 4 1/2", l1.6#, HC P-

110, LTC CASING. SHOE DEPTH 11,695', FLOAT COLLAR 11,652', 20' MARKER JTS 8989-9009' & 6334-6354'.

NO TIGHT SPOTS OR FILL. STRING WEIGHT 112,000# BEFORE CEMENTING.

09:00 11:00 2.0 CIRCULATED FOR CEMENT.

11:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL TO CEMENT. SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURETESTED LINES TO 5,000 PSI.

PUMP JOB AS FOLLOWS:20 BBLS MUD FLUSH, 20 BBLS H2OAHEAD, LEAD SLURRY: 713 SX (2182 CU/FT) G
HI LIFT 3.05YLD, 11.5 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H2O, + 12% D020 +1% DO79+ .2% Dl67 + .2% DO46+ 2% D013 + .

25#/SK D029. TAIL SLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, 1.29 YLD, 14.1 PPG, 5.96 GAUSK H2O, + 2%

D020 + .1% DO46 + .1% DOl3 + .2% Dl67 + .2% DO65. DROPPED PLUG AND DISPLACED W/185.8 BBL H2O.
MAX PRESSURE 2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUG TO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK .2 BBL, FLOATS HELD. RD
SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL. PU BOP AND SET SLIPS Wl80,000 LBS (NO BLOCK WEIGHT). EST TOP OF

CEMENT 4,000'.

15:00 18:00 3.0 CLEANEDMUD TANKS.

18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVING RIGTO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL COMPLETION
COMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @ 18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.

CASINGPOINT COST $1,026,411
DIESEL TRANSFERRED TO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS @ $1.40/GAL.

09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $27,575 Daily Total $27,575

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $173,419 Well Total $1,199,830

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10M BOPE. RUCUTTERSWL RaN CBL/VDL/GRICCL FROM PBTD TO 8000' & ACROSSCEMENT TOP @
3550'. RDWL. PRESSURE TESTED CASING, BOPE & FLOW EQUIPMENT TO 8500 PSIG FOR 15 MIN. SDFN.

09-04-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $115,879 Daily Total $115,879

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $289,298 Well Total $1,315,709
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

02:00 06:00 4.0 RU WESTATES CASING TOOLS. SAFETY MEETING. RUN 4 1/2", 11.6#, P-110, LTC CASINGAS FOLLOWS:

FLOAT SHOE, 1 JT CASING, FLOAT COLLAR, CASING. CENTRALIZERS ON MIDDLE FIRST JOINT, EVERY

OTHER JOINT TO 8800' (37 TOTAL). MARKER JOINTS @ 901l' AND 6336'. (4100' OF CASING PICKED UP @

REPORT TIME).

SAFETY MEETING: LD DRILL PIPE

08-31-2004 Reported By PAT CLARK

DailyCosts: Drilling $104,377 Completion $145,844 Daily Total $250,222

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $145,844 Well Total $1,172,255

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 11.0 Visc 44.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 FINISHED RUNNING TGTAL OF 293 JOINTS (291 FULL JTS + 2 - 20' MARKER JOINTS)OF 4 1/2", l1.6#, HC P-

110, LTC CASING. SHOE DEPTH 11,695', FLOAT COLLAR 11,652', 20' MARKER JTS 8989-9009' & 6334-6354'.

NO TIGHT SPOTS OR FILL. STRING WEIGHT 112,000# BEFORE CEMENTING.

09:00 11:00 2.0 CIRCULATED FOR CEMENT.

11:00 15:00 4.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL TO CEMENT. SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURETESTED LINES TO 5,000 PSI.

PUMP JOB AS FOLLOWS:20 BBLS MUD FLUSH, 20 BBLS H2OAHEAD, LEAD SLURRY: 713 SX (2182 CU/FT) G
HI LIFT 3.05YLD, 11.5 PPG, 18.65 GAL/SK H2O, + 12% D020 +1% DO79+ .2% Dl67 + .2% DO46+ 2% D013 + .

25#/SK D029. TAIL SLURRY 838 SX (1016 CU/FT) 50/50 POZ G, 1.29 YLD, 14.1 PPG, 5.96 GAUSK H2O, + 2%

D020 + .1% DO46 + .1% DOl3 + .2% Dl67 + .2% DO65. DROPPED PLUG AND DISPLACED W/185.8 BBL H2O.
MAX PRESSURE 2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUG TO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK .2 BBL, FLOATS HELD. RD
SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL. PU BOP AND SET SLIPS Wl80,000 LBS (NO BLOCK WEIGHT). EST TOP OF

CEMENT 4,000'.

15:00 18:00 3.0 CLEANEDMUD TANKS.

18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVING RIGTO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL COMPLETION

COMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @ 18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.

CASINGPOINT COST $1,026,411
DIESEL TRANSFERRED TO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS @ $1.40/GAL.

09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $27,575 Daily Total $27,575

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $173,419 Well Total $1,199,830
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09-04-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $115,879 Daily Total $115,879

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $289,298 Well Total $1,315,709
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MAX PRESSURE 2353 PSI, BUMPED PLUG TO 2856 PSI. BLED BACK .2 BBL, FLOATS HELD. RD
SCHLUMBERGER/DOWELL. PU BOP AND SET SLIPS Wl80,000 LBS (NO BLOCK WEIGHT). EST TOP OF

CEMENT 4,000'.

15:00 18:00 3.0 CLEANEDMUD TANKS.

18:00 06:00 12.0 RDMO. MOVING RIGTO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL COMPLETION

COMMENCES.

SAFETY MEETING: RUNNING CASING

06:00 RIG RELEASED @ 18:00 HRS, 8/30/04.

CASINGPOINT COST $1,026,411
DIESEL TRANSFERRED TO STAGECOACH UNIT 82-20: 3,000 GALS @ $1.40/GAL.

09-03-2004 Reported By SEARLE

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $27,575 Daily Total $27,575

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $173,419 Well Total $1,199,830

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLACKHAWK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 17:00 10.0 NU 10M BOPE. RUCUTTERSWL RaN CBL/VDL/GRICCL FROM PBTD TO 8000' & ACROSSCEMENT TOP @
3550'. RDWL. PRESSURE TESTED CASING, BOPE & FLOW EQUIPMENT TO 8500 PSIG FOR 15 MIN. SDFN.

09-04-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling 50 Completion $115,879 Daily Total $115,879

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $289,298 Well Total $1,315,709
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATED SUNNYSIDE FROM 11391'-93', 11406'-09', 11433'-34', 11462'-63', 11485'-87'
& 11503'-05' W/3-1/8" HSC PORTED CASING GUNS @ 2 SPF & 180? PHASING. RDWL.

RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASINGWl4959GALYF125ST PAD, 45,381 GALYF125ST & YF118ST &
168,556#20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP 8348 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 6671 PSIG. ATR 46.2 BPM. ISIP 4200
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K COMPOSITEFRACPLUG @ 11323'. PERFORATED BLACKHAWK FROM 11122'-25', 11153-

55', 11229'-30', 11249'-50', 11274'-76' & 11289'-91' @ 2 SPF & 180? PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRACDOWNCASING WI4973 GAL YF125ST PAD, 58580 GAL YFl25ST & YF118ST & 243,775# 20/40 SAND @ 1--

6 PPG. MTP 8381 PSIG. MTR 49.7 BPM. ATP 5671 PSIG. ATR 42.8 BPM. ISIP 5600 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 16 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIG. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED 1110 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.

09-05-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $3,800 Daily Total $3,800

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $293,098 Well Total $1,319,509

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 16/64" CHOKE. FCP 1200 PSIG. 30-35 BFPH. RECOVERED 920 BLW. 1220 BLWTR.

09-06-2004 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $3,450 Daily Total $3,450

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $296,548 Well Total $1,322,959

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 200 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. FLARINGBETWEENFLUID SLUGS. MINIMAL
CONDENSATE. RECOVERED 790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.

09-07-2004 Reported By SEARLE

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $3,450 Daily Total $3,450

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $299,998 Well Total $1,326,409

MD I1,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW 24 HRS ON 24/64 CHOKE. FCP 150 PSIG. EST 10-12 BPH. RECOVERED 265 BLW 525 BLWTR. FLUID
COMMING IN SLUGS NOT CONSTANT FLOW.

09-08-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $13,360 Daily Total $13,360
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517
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06:00 06:00 24.0 RU CUTTERSWL. PERFORATED SUNNYSIDE FROM 11391'-93', 11406'-09', 11433'-34', 11462'-63', 11485'-87'
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FLOWED 16 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FCP 2800 PSIG. 50 BFPH. RECOVERED 1110 BLW. 2140 BLWTR.
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CONDENSATE. RECOVERED 790 BLWTR. 790 BLWTR.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $313,358 Well Total $1,339,769

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 252 BLW. 273 BLWTR.

MIRU DUCO RIG #3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $53,605 Daily Total $53,605

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $366,963 Well Total $1,393,374

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE & BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUG @ l1,323'. RIH. FILL
@ 11,469'. CLEANED OUT TO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $7,610 Daily Total $7,610

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $374,573 Well Total $1,400,984

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POH W/I'UBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 0 PSIG. RUTO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS & WELL STARTED FLOWING.
RECOVERED 44 BLW. FLOWED 4 HRS. ON 32/64" CHOKE & LOGGED OFF. MADE 14 SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTED FLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW. FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPEN CHOKE & LOGGED OFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELL OPEN ON 16/64" CHOKE OVERNIGHT. 115 BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $17,465 Daily Total $17,465

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $392,038 Well Total $1,418,449

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MOVE IN FRACFLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00 AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FTP 0 PSIG, CP 1750 PSIG. CIRCULATED WELL W/TREATED WATER. POH. RU

COMPUTALOGWL. SET CIBP @ 11,100'.

PERFORATED CASTLEGATE FROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32' & 11,065-66' Wl3-

1/8" HSC PORTED CASING GUNS @ 2 SPF & 180? PHASING. SICP OPSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,440 Daily Total $2,440

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $394,478 Well Total $1,420,889
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $313,358 Well Total $1,339,769

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. FCP 75-100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 252 BLW. 273 BLWTR.

MIRU DUCO RIG #3. SDFN.

09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $53,605 Daily Total $53,605

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $366,963 Well Total $1,393,374

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST SUNNYSIDE & BLACKHAWK ZONES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 11,323'. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUG @ l1,323'. RIH. FILL
@ 11,469'. CLEANED OUT TO 11,639'. POH TO 11,342'. SDFN.

09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $7,610 Daily Total $7,610

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $374,573 Well Total $1,400,984

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: POH W/I'UBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 0 PSIG. SICP 0 PSIG. RUTO SWAB. IFL @500'. MADE 4 SWAB RUNS & WELL STARTED FLOWING.
RECOVERED 44 BLW. FLOWED 4 HRS. ON 32/64" CHOKE & LOGGED OFF. MADE 14 SWAB RUNS & WELL
STARTED FLOWING. RECOVERED 138 BLW. FLOWED 2 HRS. ON OPEN CHOKE & LOGGED OFF. CP 600
PSIG. LEFT WELL OPEN ON 16/64" CHOKE OVERNIGHT. 115 BLWTR.

09-11-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $17,465 Daily Total $17,465

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $392,038 Well Total $1,418,449

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10893-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MOVE IN FRACFLUID

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 5:00 AM, 16/64" CHOKE, FTP 0 PSIG, CP 1750 PSIG. CIRCULATED WELL W/TREATED WATER. POH. RU

COMPUTALOGWL. SET CIBP @ 11,100'.

PERFORATED CASTLEGATE FROM 10,893-95', 10,921-24', 10,936-39', 10,988-90', 11,031-32' & 11,065-66' Wl3-

1/8" HSC PORTED CASING GUNS @ 2 SPF & 180? PHASING. SICP OPSIG. SDFN.

09-12-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,440 Daily Total $2,440

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $394,478 Well Total $1,420,889
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property:055517

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $313,358 Well Total $1,339,769

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RUN PRODUCTION TUBING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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09-09-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $53,605 Daily Total $53,605

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $366,963 Well Total $1,393,374

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
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09-10-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN
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Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 11122-11505 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERPARE FOR FRACS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 PREP TO FRAC.

09-14-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $14,204 Daily Total $14,204

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $408,682 Well Total $1,435,093

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10635-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC BLUE CASTLE ZONE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC CASTLEGATE DOWN CASING Wl5000 GALYFl25ST PAD, 53,760 GALSYFl25ST

& YF118ST & 212,500# 20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. SCREENED OUT Wl40 BBLS FLUSH REMAINING. 206,300#

SAND IN FORMATION. MTP 8588 PSIG. MTR 50.9 BPM. ATP 6933 PSIG. ATR 44.2 BPM. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 3.5 HRS THROUGH 10/64" & 24/64" CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED 289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR.

SLIGHT SAND.

RUWL. PERFORATED NELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52' @
2 SPF & 180? PHASING. SET COMPOSITE FRAC PLUG @ 10,882'. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER PUMPS.
FRACED DOWN CASINGWl5000 GALSYF125ST PAD, 49,518 GALSYFl25ST & YFl18ST & 193,000#20/40
SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP 8555 PSIG. MTR 47.2 BPM. ATP 7546 PSIG. ATR 37 BPM. ISIP 4625 PSIG. SDFN.

09-15-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $137,797 Daily Total $137,797

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $546,479 Well Total $1,572,890

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP 3700 PSIG. RUWL. SET WEATHERFORD COMPOSITE FRACPLUG @ 10,359'. PERFED BLUE CASTLE
FROM 10,243-45', 10,253-54', 10,269-71', 10,288-90', 10,312-14' & 10,323-25' @ 2 SPF & 180? PHASING. RDWL.

RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACED DOWN CASINGW/5000 GALSYF12ST PAD, 38,430 GALSYFl25ST & YF118ST

& 139,100#20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP 7712 PSIG. MTR 47.2 BPM. ATP6218 PSIG. ATR 43 BPM. ISIP 4370

PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET COMPOSITE FRACPLUG @ 10,225'. UNABLE TO GET OFF PLUG. PULLED OUT OF ROPE

SOCKET. RDWL. (FISH CONSISTS OF 1-7/16" CABLE HEAD, 3-1/8" COLLAR LOCATOR, 3-1/8" QUICK

CHANGE, 19' X 3-1/8" CASING GUN, SETTINGTOOLADAFTER, FIRING HEAD, SETTING TOOL & SETTING

SLEEVE. OVER ALL LENGTH32.5'). RD SCHLUMBERGER.

FLOWED 14.25 HRS ON 10/64" TO 24/64" CHOKE. AT 5 AM, 24/64" CHOKE, FCP 400 PSIG, 55-60 BFPH.

RECOVERED903 BLW. 2996 BLWTR.

09-16-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $14,763 Daily Total $14,763

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $561,242 Well Total $1,587,653

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517
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FLOWED 3.5 HRS THROUGH 10/64" & 24/64" CHOKES. FCP 3000 PSIG. RECOVERED 289 BLW. 1239 BLWTR.

SLIGHT SAND.

RUWL. PERFORATED NELSON FROM 10,635-38', 10,694-95', 10,728-30', 10,792-95', 10,819-20' & 10,849-52' @
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILL FRACPLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 4 HRS ON 32/64" CHOKE. FCP 100 PSIG. 10-12 BFPH. RECOVERED 48 BLW. 2948 BLWTR. KILLED
WELL Wl75 BBLS TREATED WATER. RIH W/OVERSHOT, JARS & BUMPER SUB TO 10,210'. CIRCULATED TO
TOP OF FISH @ 10,225'. LATCHED ONTO FISH. WORKED FISH FREE. POH. LAYED DOWN FISH & FISHING
TOOLS. RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB TO 9985'. SDFN.

09-17-2004 Reported By HANSELMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $48,275 Daily Total $48,275

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $609,517 Well Total $1,635,928

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 33 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PERF UPPER BLUE CASTLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 1900 PSIG. SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. KILLED TUBING W/25 BBLSTREATED WATER. RIH
TO BP @ 10,225'. POH TO 9993'. DISPLACED HOLE W/TREATED WATER. PRESSURE TESTED BP TO 4000
PSIG. POH. SDFN.

09-18-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $11,809 Daily Total $11,809

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $621,326 Well Total $1,647,737

MD 11.700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

09:00 12:30 3.5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RU CUTTERS WL. PERFORATED BLUE CASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',
10,178-80', 10185-88' & 10,193-95' @ 2 SPF & 180? PHASING. RDWL. SI. WO FRAC.

09-21-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $6,550 Daily Total $6,550

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $627,876 Well Total $1,654,287

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURING RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER HAD EQUIPMENT FAILURE. SI. WO FRACEQUIPMENT.

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $52,147 Daily Total $52,147

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $680,023 Well Total $1,706,434

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC BLUE CASTLE DOWN CASING W/4946 GALS YF125ST PAD,
40,903 GALS YFl25ST & YF118ST & 145,800# 20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6184 PSIG. ATR 42.4 BPM. ISIP 3875 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER. LEFT FRAC HEAD ON BOPs. BLIND RAMS
WOULD NGT FULLY CLOSE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Activity at Report Time: DRILL FRACPLUGS

Start End Hrs Activity Description
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Activity at Report Time: PERF UPPER BLUE CASTLE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SITP 1900 PSIG. SICP 2000 PSIG. BLEW WELL DOWN. KILLED TUBING W/25 BBLSTREATED WATER. RIH
TO BP @ 10,225'. POH TO 9993'. DISPLACED HOLE W/TREATED WATER. PRESSURE TESTED BP TO 4000
PSIG. POH. SDFN.

09-18-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $11,809 Daily Total $11,809

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $621,326 Well Total $1,647,737

MD 11.700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 34 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

09:00 12:30 3.5 SICP 2100 PSIG. RU CUTTERS WL. PERFORATED BLUE CASTLE FROM 10,112-14', 10,115-17', 10,120-22',
10,178-80', 10185-88' & 10,193-95' @ 2 SPF & 180? PHASING. RDWL. SI. WO FRAC.

09-21-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $6,550 Daily Total $6,550

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $627,876 Well Total $1,654,287

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 35 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI. WO FRAC.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 10:00 3.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. DURING RIG UP SCHLUMBERGER HAD EQUIPMENT FAILURE. SI. WO FRACEQUIPMENT.

09-23-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $52,147 Daily Total $52,147

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $680,023 Well Total $1,706,434

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 36 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10243-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

07:00 06:00 23.0 SICP 2400 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC BLUE CASTLE DOWN CASING W/4946 GALS YF125ST PAD,
40,903 GALS YFl25ST & YF118ST & 145,800# 20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP 8055 PSIG. MTR 45.2 BPM. ATP
6184 PSIG. ATR 42.4 BPM. ISIP 3875 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER. LEFT FRAC HEAD ON BOPs. BLIND RAMS
WOULD NGT FULLY CLOSE.
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

FLOWED WELL 21 HRS ON 32/64"CHOKE. FCP 450 PSIG. 20 BFPH. RECOVERED 712 BLW. 3495 BLWTR.

09-24-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $7,600 Daily Total $7,600

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $687,623 Well Total $1,714,034

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 37 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 2 HRS ON AN OPEN CHOKE. FCP O PSIG. PUMPED 85 BBLS TREATED WATER DOWN CASING. RIH
W/3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF SUB. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @ 10,225', 10,359' & 10,882'. RIH.
CLEANEDOUT TO CIBP @ 11,100'. LANDED TUBING @ 11,061' KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. DROPPEDBALL &
PUMPED OFF BIT & SUB.

FLOWED 10 HRS ON 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 500 PSIG. CP 500 PSIG. 5-7 BFPH. RECOVERED 180 BLW. 3762
BLWTR.

TUBING DETAIL : LENGTH

PUMP OFF ASSEMBLY .91'

1 JT 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 EUE TUBING 32.61'

XN NIPPLE 1.25'

337 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# N80 TUBING 11,012.35'

BELOW KB 14.00'

LANDED AT 11,061.12' KB

09-25-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $10,063 Daily Total $10,063

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $697,686 Well Total $1.724,097

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 38 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 RDMOSU.

FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1125 PSIG. 1-3 BFPH. RECOVERED 69 BLW. 3513 BLWTR.

09-26-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $6,790 Daily Total $6,790

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $704,476 Well Total $1,730,887

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 39 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 300 PSIG. CP 1000 PSIG. 1 BFPH. RECOVERED 75 BLW. 3438 BLWTR.

06:00
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

09-27-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,590 Daily Total $2,590

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $707,066 Well Total $1,733,477

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 40 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 24/64" CHOKE. FTP 400 PSIG. CP 1050 PSIG. 1-2 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.
RECOVERED 75 BLW 3363 BLWTR.

09-28-2004 Reported By HANSEN

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $2,590 Daily Total $2,590

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $709,656 Well Total $1,736,067

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 41 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW TEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS. 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 800 PSIG. CP 1450 PSIG. 2-3 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.
RECOVERED 60 BLW. 3303 BLWTR.

09-29-2004 Reported By HANSEN

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $990 Daily Total $990

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $710,646 Well Total $1,737,057

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 42 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : I 1652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI - WO FURTHER ACTIVITY

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 FLOWED 6 HRS ON 12/64" CHOKE. FTP 750 PSIG. CP 1500 PSIG. 3-5 BFPH. TRACE OF CONDENSATE.
RECOVERED 24 BLW. 3279 BLWTR. SI.

07-24-2006 Reported By RANCE RASMUSSEN

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $710,646 Well Total $1,737,057

MD 11,700 TVD l1,700 Progress 0 Days 43 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 INITIAL PRODUCTION. OPENINGPRESSURE 3400 TBG & 4600 CSG PSI. TURN WELL OVER TO QUESTAR AT
1:00 PM, 7/21/06. FLOWED 849 MCFD RATE ON 10/64" CHOKE.

07-25-2006 Reported By ROGER DART

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $710,646 Well Total $1,737,057

MD 11,700 TVD 11.700 Progress 0 Days 44 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES
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Well Name: STATE 01-32 Field: BIG SPRING Property: 055517

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 581 MCFD, 30 BC & 215 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK. FTP2000 & CP 3300 PSIG.

07-26-2006 Reported By ROGER DART

Daily Costs: DriHing $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $1,026,410 Completion $710,646 WeH Total $1,737,057

MD 11,700 TVD 11,700 Progress 0 Days 45 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 11652.0 Perf : 10112-11066 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 545 MCFD, 20 BC & 150 BW IN 24 HRS ON 10/64" CK. FTP 1800 & CP 3200 PSIG.
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT Executive Director
Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

March 2, 2011

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7004 1160 0003 0190 4970

Ms. Kaylene Gardner
EOG Resources, Inc.
1060 East Highway 40
Vernal, UT 84078

Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases

Dear Ms. Gardner:

As of January 2011, EOG Resources, Inc. has three (3) State Lease Wells (see attachment
A) that are currently in non-compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in or
temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status.

Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged,
unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by
the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT.

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City,UT 84114 -5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile(801)359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wwwogm.utah.gov oxt, GAS &
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Subject: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements for Fee or State Leases

Dear Ms. Gardner:

As of January 2011, EOG Resources, Inc. has three (3) State Lease Wells (see attachment
A) that are currently in non-compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in or
temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status.

Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged,
unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by
the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).

2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and

3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has
integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT.

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City,UT 84114 -5801
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State of Utah
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Page 2
EOG Resources, Inc.
March 2, 2011

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may helpqualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TArule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and

casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and
4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerningthis matter, please contact me at(801) 538-5281.

Si y,

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
cc: p File

LaVonne Garrison, SITLA

N:\O&G Reviewed
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API LEASE Years inactive
1 PETES WASH 32-2 43-013-32453 ML-47068 1 Year 11 Months
2 CWU 486-2F 43-047-32949 ML-3077 1 Year 3 Months
3 STATE 1-32 43-047-35839 ML-48380 1 Year 5
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State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAEL R. STYLER

GARY R. HERBERT
Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GREGORY S. BELL JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Govemor Division Director

January 26, 2012

CERTIFIED MAIL NO.: 7011 0110 0001 3568 1779

Ms. Kaylene Gardner
EOG Resources, Inc.
1060 East Highway 40
Vernal, UT 84078

Subject: Second Notice: Extended Shut-in and Temporary Abandoned Well Requirements
for Fee or State Leases

Dear Ms. Gardner:

As of January 2012, EOG Resources, Inc. (EOG) has three (3) State Lease Wells (see
attachment A) that are currently in non-compliance with the requirements for extended shut-in or
temporarily abandoned (SI/TA) status.

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining (Division) wishes to inform EOG that these
wells already had notices sent out March, 2011. The Division has not received any
correspondence from EOG concerning these matters nor seen indication of effort being made to
move these wells out of non-compliance status.

Wells SI/TA beyond twelve (12) consecutive months requires filing a Sundry Notice
(R649-3-36-1). Wells with five (5) years non-activity or non-productivity shall be plugged,
unless the Division grants approval for extended shut-in time upon a showing of good cause by
the operator (649-3-36-1.3.3). For extended SI/TA consideration the operator shall provide the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining with the following:

1. Reasons for SI/TA of the well (R649-3-36-1.1).
2. The length of time the well is expected to be SI/TA (R649-3-36-1.2), and
3. An explanation and supporting data if necessary, for showing the well has

integrity, meaning that the casing, cement, equipment condition, static fluid level,
pressure, existence or absence of Underground Sources of Drinking Water and
other factors do not make the well a risk to public health and safety or the
environment (R649-3-36-1.3).

Please note that the Divisions preferred method for showing well integrity is by MIT. .

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114 -5801

telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &
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Page 2
EOG Resources, Inc.
January 26, 2012

Submitting the information suggested below may help show well integrity and may help
qualify your well for extended SI/TA. Note: As of July 1, 2003, wells in violation of the SI/TA
rule R649-3-36 may be subject to full cost bonding (R649-3-1-4.2, 4.3).

1. Wellbore diagram, and
2. Copy of recent casing pressure test, and
3. Current pressures on the wellbore (tubing pressure, casing pressure, and

casing/casing annuli pressure) showing wellbore has integrity, and
4. Fluid level in the wellbore, and
5. An explanation of how the submitted information proves integrity.

If the required information is not received within 30 days of the date of this notice, further
actions may be initiated. If you have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me at
(801) 538-5281.

incer

Dustin K. Doucet
Petroleum Engineer

DKD/JP/js
Enclosure
ec: Compliance File

Well File
LaVonne Garrison, SITLA

N:\O&G Reviewed
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ATTACHMENT A

Well Name API LEASE Years inactive

1 PETES WASH 32-2 43-013-32453 ML-47068 2 Years 11 Months

2 CWU 486-2F 43-047-32949 ML-3077 2 Years 3 Months

3 STATE 1-32 43-047-35839 ML-48380 2 Years 5
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RECEIVED: Apr. 11, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-48380 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
  

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 STATE 1-32 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG Resources, Inc.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UTELAND BUTTE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2152 FNL 2067 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

4 /11 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests to Plug and Abandon the
referenced well as per the attached procedure. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145

TITLE
 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 4 /11 /2012

August 09, 2012

Sundry Number: 24756 API Well Number: 43047358390000Sundry Number: 24756 API Well Number: 43047358390000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well STATE 1-32

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOG Resources, Inc. 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext UTELANDBUTTE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2152 FNL 2067 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/11/2012
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12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests to Plug and Abandon the Approved by the
referenced well as per the attached procedure. Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: August 09, 2012

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/11/2012
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FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2152 FNL 2067 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

4/11/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENTOR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. respectfully requests to Plug and Abandon the Approved by the
referenced well as per the attached procedure. Utah Division of

OFI, Gas and Mining

Date: August 09, 2012

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Mickenzie Gates 435 781-9145 Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 4/11/2012

RECEIVED: Apr. 11,
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The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Sundry Conditions of Approval Well Number 43047358390000

1. Notify the Division at least 24 hours prior to conducting abandonment operations. Please call
Dan Jarvis at 801-538-5338. 

2. Amend Plug #1: A minimum of 8 sx shall be spotted on the CIBP @ 10050’ not 5 sx as
proposed. 

3. Add Plug #3A: A 300’ plug (±23 sx) shall be balanced from ±3600’ to 3300’. This will isolate
the intermediate shoe, cement top and base of the Moderately Saline Groundwater as required by

rule R649-3-24-3.3.  

4. Amend Plug #4: This plug shall be an inside/outside plug. RIH and perforate @ 1450’. Establish
circulation down the 4 ½” casing back up the 4 ½” x 9 5/8” annulus. If injection into the perfs

cannot be established a 200’ plug (±16 sx) shall be balanced from ±1500’ to 1300’. If injection is
established: RIH with CICR and set at 1400’. M&P 45 sx cement, sting into CICR pump 33 sx,

sting out and dump 12 sx on top of CICR. This will isolate the top of the Green River formation. 

5. All balanced plugs shall be tagged to ensure that they are at the depth specified. 

6. All annuli shall be cemented from a minimum depth of 100’ to the surface. 

7. Surface reclamation shall be done in accordance with R649-3-34 – Well Site Restoration. 

8. All requirements in the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rule R649-3-24 shall apply. 

9. If there are any changes to the procedure or the wellbore configuration, notify Dustin Doucet
at 801-538-5281 (ofc) or 801-733-0983 (home) prior to continuing with the procedure. 

10. All other requirements for notice and reporting in the Oil and Gas Conservation General
Rules shall apply. 
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8/8/2012 Wellbore Diagram r263

API Weil¯No: 43 047-35839.00-00 - Permit No: ¯ ¯ ¯ Well Name/No: STATE I-32

Company Name: EOG RESOURCES, INC.

Location: See: 32 T: 10S R: 18E Spot: SENW String Information

Coordinates: X: 592351 Y: 4417403 Bottom Diameter Weight Length CP )
String (ft sub) (inches) (Ib/ft) (ft)

Field Name: UTELAND BUTTE
HOLl 239 17.5

County Name: UINTAH SURF 239 13.375 48 239
HOL2 3400 12.25

Il 3400 9.625 36 3400
4 ŸŒ HOL3 11695 7.875

Cement from 239 ft to surface ¿¡ge
PROD 11695 4.5 (o.o FÄ) 11.6 11695

Surface: 13.375 in. @239 n.
Tl 11061 2.375

Hole: 17.5 in. @239 ft 15 /1 3. ÏŸ2

Cement from 3400 ft to surface Cement Information 2
termedíate: 9.625 in. @3400 ft. BOC TOC s .a e C-

Ho 12.25 in. @3400 ft String (ft sub) (ft sub) Class Sacks
Tee Il 3400 0 G 285 i PP 3, O I CF GA

co' Il 3400 0 -4]EÚn 320 l4.1pp i la CF SA

PROD 11695 3550 UK 1551

sutit Cid / SURF 239 0 G 225

MHoANI <cNW .. P€rforation Information
Top Bottom

2(a ' (ft sub) (ft sub) Shts/Ft No Shts Dt Squeeze

Formation Information

uc (059.8 -- Formation Depth

W
CW 34

(gi
CHPTA 5219

Cement from 11695 ft to 3550 ft. NHORN 6956
MVRD 8744

Tubing: 2.375 in. @ 11061 ft
CSLGT 10778

Production: 4.5 in. @11695 ft

Hole: 7.875 in. @ l1695 ft D
S(AAND ((39½ - Hole:Unknown KNWTH 11661

KNWngg ¡'
: 11700 TVD: 11700 PBTD: 11652

/ÓO ('t./ X,.c ex Re -

TO C O Page
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RECEIVED: Apr. 11, 2012

Sundry Number: 24756 API Well Number: 43047358390000Sundry Number: 24756 API Well Number: 43047358390000

PLUG & ABANDON PROGRAM

State 1-32 March 26, 2012
2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE/NW) EOG WI: 50.0000%
Section 32, T10S, R18E NRI: 43.750000%
Uintah County, Utah API# 43-047-35839

AFE# 313108

WELL DATA:

ELEVATION: 5571' GL KB: 5585' (14'KB)

TOTAL DEPTH: 11700' PBTD: 11652'
CIBP: 11100'

CASING: 13-3/8", 48#, H-40 set @ 239' KB. Cemented w/225 sxs Class 'G'.
9-5/8", 36#, J-55 set @ 3400' KB. Cemented w/285 sxs Class 'G',
followed by 320 sxs Class 'G' .

4 ½", 11.6#, P-110 set @ 11695' KB. Cemented w/713 sxs Hi-Lift 'G',
followed by 838 sxs 50/50 Pozmix.

TUBING: 2-3/8" Notched Collar
1 jt. 2-3/8", 4.7#, N-80
XN Nipple
337 jts. 2-3/8", 4.7#, N-80 tubing
Landed @ 11061' KB

PERFORATIONS: 10112'-11505'

PROCEDURE:

1. MIRU SU. ND wellhead. NU BOPE. POH with tubing.

2. PU 3 7/8" bit and 4 ½" scraper. RIH to 10075'. POH and lay down tools.

3. PU CIBP. RIH to 10050'. Set CIBP at 10050'+/-. RU cement company. Spot 5 sxs of class
"G" w/2% CaCl2 on top of CIBP. PUH filling the casing with 9 ppg brine to 8850'.

4. RU cement company. Spot 15 sxs of class "G" w/2%CaCl2 cement plug from 8650' to 8850',
100' above the Mesaverde formation top.

5. PUH filling casing with 9 ppg brine to
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Sundry Number: 24756 API Well Number: 43047358390000Sundry Number: 24756 API Well Number: 43047358390000

6. RU cement company. Spot 15 sxs of class "G" w/2% CaCl2 cement plug from 4450' to 4650',
100' above the Wasatch formation top.

7. PUH filling casing with 9 ppg brine to 1450'.

8. RU cement company. Spot 15 sxs of class "G" w/2% CaCl2 cement plug from 1250' to 1450',
100' above the Green River formation top.

9. PUH filling casing with 9 ppg brine to 300'. POOH.

10. RUWL. Shoot four squeeze holes at 300' using a 3 1/8" HSC ported gun, 12 gram charges, 90
degree phase. RDWL.

11. Pump down the 4 ½" casing trying to establish circulation from 300' up the 4 ½" X 9 5/8" casing
annulus.

12. Pump 130 sxs of Class "G" w/ 2% CaCl2 down the 4 ½" casing. Should circulate out 5 bb1s of
cement, leaving 4 ½" casing full. If necessary do a top off job.

13. Cut of casing head. Weld on marker plate ± 3' below ground level. Remove anchors and
backfill over the marker.

PREPARED BY:
J.H. Kennah, Production Engineering Advisor

APPROVED BY:
Ted Kelly, Operations
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WELLBORE DIAGRAM

Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
Field Name: Alger Pass
Well Name: State 1-32

Location: 2152' FNL & 2067' FWL (SE NW) Sec. 32-T10S-R18E
County: Uintah

API #: 4304735839
Date: 2/3/05

GL: 5571'

KB: 5585'

( ) Spud Date: 8/7/04

~ ~ ~ ~ ( ) ~ ~ ~ Completion Date: 9/23/04

) Surface Casing: 13-3/8", 48#, H-40 @ 239'
) wl225 ex Class G cmt

( ) Original Completion:
( ) Formation: Perforations: Treatment:

( ) Blue Castle 10,112'-14', 10,115'-17', 4,946 gals YF-125 fluid
( ) 10,120'-22', 10,178'-80', and 40,903 gais YF-118 & YF-125 fluid

) 10,185'-88', 10,193'-95' (2 SPF) w/145,800#20/40 sand down csg

Blue Castle ( )
( ) Blue Castle 10,243'-45', 10,253'-54', 5,000 cyalsYF-125 fluid
( ) 10,269'-71', 10,288'-90', and 38,430 gals YF-118 &YF-125 fluid
( 10,312'-14', 10,323'-25' (2 SPF) w/139,1005 20/40 sand down csq

Blue Castle (
( ) Nelson 10,635'-38', 10,694'-95', 5,000 gals YF-125 fluid
( ) 10,728'-30', 10,792'-95', and 49,518 gals YF-118 &YF-125 fluid

10,819'-20', 10,849'-52' (2 SPF) w/193,0000 20/40 sand down cag
Nelson ( )

( ) Castlegate 10,893'-95', 10,921'-24', 5,000 gais YF-125 fluid
( ) 10,936'-39', 10,988'-90', and 53,760 galsYF-118 &YF-125 fluid
( ) 11,031'-32', 11,065'-66' (2 SPF) wl212,500# 20f40 sand down cag

) Screened out w/206,3000 sand in formation

Castlegate ( )
( ) Blackhawk 11,122'-25', 11,153'-55', 4,973 gals YF-125 fluid
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( ) Intermediate Casing: 9-5/8", 36#, J-55 @ 3400'
( ) w)285 ex Class G cmt followed by
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WELLBORE DIAGRAM
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 10/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N9550- EOG Resources, Inc. N2615- XTO Energy, Inc.
600 17th Street, Suite 1000N P.O. Box 6501
Denver, CO 80202 Englewood, CO 80155

Phone: 1 (303) 824-5484 Phone: 1 (303) 397-3600

CA No. Unit: N/A

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL
NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

State 1-32 32 10S 18E 4304735839 14264 State GW S

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 10/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 12/11/2012

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 12/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 5655506-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 12/27/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA N/A
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 12/28/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 12/28/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 12/27/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 12/28/2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: N/A
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A

BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 82322706

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A
COMMENTS:

XTO Energy.xls

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 5
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

DESIGNATION OF AGENT OR OPERATOR

The undersigned is, on record, the holder of oil and gas lease

LEASE NAME: State 1-32 C .

LEASE NUMBER: ML-m egg OCT25 2012
DIV.0FOILGABAMMIS

and hereby designates

NAME: XTO Energy

ADDRESS: PO Box 6501

city Englewood state CO zip 80155

as his (check one) agent O / operator 2, with full authority to act in his behalf in complying with the terms of the lease and
regulations applicable thereto and on whom the Division Director or Authorized Agent may serve written or oral instructions in
securing compliance with the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining
of the State of Utah with respect to:

(Describe acreage to which this designation is applicable. Identify each oiland gas well by API number and name. Attach additional pages as
needed.)

EOG Resources, Inc. has assigned all of its right, title and interest in the referenced well to XTO Energy and will
relinquish and transferoperatorship of the subject well to XTO Energy.

XTO Energy will be considered to be the operator of the referenced well and will be responsible under the termsand
conditions of the applicable lease for the operations conducted upon the leased la vided
under XTO Energy Bond No. 104312762. 41

DEC28 20t2
Div.OiL GAS &MINING

It is understood that this designation of agentloperator does not relieve the lessee of responsibility for compliance with the terms
of the lease and the Oil and Gas Conservation General Rules and Procedural Rules of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining of the
State of Utah. It is also understood that thisdesignation of agent or operator does not constitute an assignment of any interest in
the lease.

In case of default on the part ofthe designated agentloperator, the lessee willmake fulland prompt compliance with all rules, lease
termsor orders of the Board of Oil, Gs and Mining of the State of Utah or its authorized representative.

The lessee agrees to pr mptly noti,y th Division Director or Authorized Agent of any change in this designation.

Effective Date of Desi ination: / ,

J. M ael Sch ' EOG Resources, Inc.
BY: (Name) OF: (company)

(Signature) . (Address) 600 17th Street, Suite 1000N

(Titie) Agent and Att rney-in-Fact
city Denver

(Phone) (303) E24-5484
state CO zip 80202
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES DEC1 112ÊN2DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill newwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STATE 1-32

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APlNUMBER:

XTO ENERGY INC. g gg 4304735839
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

PO BOX 6501 CITY ENGLEWOOD STATE CO zi,80155 (303) 397-3600 UTELANDBUTTE
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL & 2067' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATlON
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

10/1/2012 CHANGE TO PREVlOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUB1NGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUClNG FORMATlONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective 10/1/12, XTO Energy Inc. assumed operations of the above mentioned well from EOG rces Inc. Ooerations
willbe conducted under XTO Energy Bond No. 104312762. Additional bonding is covered under Bond No.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Kelly K. Kardos TITLE Permitting Supervisor

SIGNATURE A ( DATE 12/10/2012

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

APPROVED
DEC2 8 2012

DIV.OIL GAS &
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a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATlON
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

10/1/2012 CHANGE TO PREVlOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUB1NGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUClNG FORMATlONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective 10/1/12, XTO Energy Inc. assumed operations of the above mentioned well from EOG rces Inc. Ooerations
willbe conducted under XTO Energy Bond No. 104312762. Additional bonding is covered under Bond No.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Kelly K. Kardos TITLE Permitting Supervisor

SIGNATURE A ( DATE 12/10/2012

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

APPROVED
DEC2 8 2012

DIV.OIL GAS &

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES DEC1 112ÊN2DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill newwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8 WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STATE 1-32

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APlNUMBER:

XTO ENERGY INC. g gg 4304735839
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

PO BOX 6501 CITY ENGLEWOOD STATE CO zi,80155 (303) 397-3600 UTELANDBUTTE
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 2152' FNL & 2067' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENW 32 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATlON
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

10/1/2012 CHANGE TO PREVlOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUB1NGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUClNG FORMATlONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective 10/1/12, XTO Energy Inc. assumed operations of the above mentioned well from EOG rces Inc. Ooerations
willbe conducted under XTO Energy Bond No. 104312762. Additional bonding is covered under Bond No.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Kelly K. Kardos TITLE Permitting Supervisor

SIGNATURE A ( DATE 12/10/2012

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

APPROVED
DEC2 8 2012

DIV.OIL GAS &



State 1-32 Estimated Cost to P&A

Line Item Estimated Cost
P&A Rig (4 days) $12,000
Cement Services $15,000
Wireline Services $5,000
Miscellaneous Items (during P&A) $2,000
Transportation Services $1,000
Surface Reclamation $20,000
Other $5,000
Total

State 1-32 Estimated Cost to P&A

Line Item Estimated Cost
P&A Rig (4 days) $12,000
Cement Services $15,000
Wireline Services $5,000
Miscellaneous Items (during P&A) $2,000
Transportation Services $1,000
Surface Reclamation $20,000
Other $5,000
Total

State 1-32 Estimated Cost to P&A

Line Item Estimated Cost
P&A Rig (4 days) $12,000
Cement Services $15,000
Wireline Services $5,000
Miscellaneous Items (during P&A) $2,000
Transportation Services $1,000
Surface Reclamation $20,000
Other $5,000
Total



RECEIVED: May. 22, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-48380 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 STATE 1-32 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 XTO ENERGY INC

9. API NUMBER:
 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 PO Box 6501 , Englewood, CO, 80155 303 397-3727  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UTELAND BUTTE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2152 FNL 2067 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

5 /21 /2014

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 XTO Energy Inc. has returned this well to production at 1300 hours on
Wednesday, 5/21/2014. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Barbara Nicol 303-397-3736

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 5 /22 /2014

May 22, 2014

Sundry Number: 51430 API Well Number: 43047358390000Sundry Number: 51430 API Well Number: 43047358390000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well STATE 1-32

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
XTOENERGYlNC 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
PO Box 6501 , Englewood, CO, 80155 303 397-3727 Ext UTELANDBUTTE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

2152 FNL 2067 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/21/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

XTO Energy Inc. has returned this well to production at 1300 hours on Accepted by the
Wednesday, 5/21/2014. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOBaggCORPONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Barbara Nicol 303-397-3736 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/22/2014

RECEIVED: May. 22,

Sundry Number: 51430 API Well Number: 43047358390000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well STATE 1-32

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
XTOENERGYlNC 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
PO Box 6501 , Englewood, CO, 80155 303 397-3727 Ext UTELANDBUTTE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

2152 FNL 2067 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/21/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

XTO Energy Inc. has returned this well to production at 1300 hours on Accepted by the
Wednesday, 5/21/2014. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOBaggCORPONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Barbara Nicol 303-397-3736 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/22/2014

RECEIVED: May. 22,

Sundry Number: 51430 API Well Number: 43047358390000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well STATE 1-32

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
XTOENERGYlNC 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
PO Box 6501 , Englewood, CO, 80155 303 397-3727 Ext UTELANDBUTTE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

2152 FNL 2067 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

5/21/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

XTO Energy Inc. has returned this well to production at 1300 hours on Accepted by the
Wednesday, 5/21/2014. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOBaggCORPONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Barbara Nicol 303-397-3736 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 5/22/2014

RECEIVED: May. 22,



RECEIVED: Jan. 09, 2015

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-48380 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 STATE 1-32 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 XTO ENERGY INC

9. API NUMBER:
 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 PO Box 6501 , Englewood, CO, 80155 303 397-3727  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UTELAND BUTTE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2152 FNL 2067 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

12/17 /2014

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 XTO Energy Inc. performed an acid treatment on this well per the
following: 12/17/2014: MIRU acid pmp trk. Pmp 500 gal 15% HCL acid

dwn csg. Pmp 40 bbl TFW flush dwn csg. Pmp 250 gal 15% HCL acid
dwn tbg. Pmp 40 bbls TFW flush dwn tbg. SWIFPBU. RDMO pmp trk. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Barbara Nicol 303-397-3736

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 1 /9 /2015

January 13, 2015

Sundry Number: 59746 API Well Number: 43047358390000Sundry Number: 59746 API Well Number: 43047358390000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well STATE 1-32

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
XTO ENERGY INC 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
PO Box 6501 , Englewood, CO, 80155 303 397-3727 Ext UTELANDBUTTE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2152 FNL 2067 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

12/17/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

XTO Energy Inc. performed an acid treatment on this well per the Accepted by the
following: 12/17/2014: MIRU acid pmp trk. Pmp 500 gal 15% HCL acid Utah Division of

dwn csg. Pmp 40 bbl TFW flush dwn csg. Pmp 250 gal 15% HCL acid Oil, Gas and Mining

dwn tbg. Pmp 40 bbls TFW flush dwn tbg. SWIFPBU. RDMO pmp trk. FOR RECORD ONLY
January 13, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Barbara Nicol 303-397-3736 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 1/9/2015

RECEIVED: Jan. 09,

Sundry Number: 59746 API Well Number: 43047358390000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well STATE 1-32

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
XTO ENERGY INC 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
PO Box 6501 , Englewood, CO, 80155 303 397-3727 Ext UTELANDBUTTE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2152 FNL 2067 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

12/17/2014
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

XTO Energy Inc. performed an acid treatment on this well per the Accepted by the
following: 12/17/2014: MIRU acid pmp trk. Pmp 500 gal 15% HCL acid Utah Division of

dwn csg. Pmp 40 bbl TFW flush dwn csg. Pmp 250 gal 15% HCL acid Oil, Gas and Mining

dwn tbg. Pmp 40 bbls TFW flush dwn tbg. SWIFPBU. RDMO pmp trk. FOR RECORD ONLY
January 13, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Barbara Nicol 303-397-3736 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 1/9/2015

RECEIVED: Jan. 09,



RECEIVED: Sep. 14, 2015

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-48380 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 STATE 1-32 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 XTO ENERGY INC

9. API NUMBER:
 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 PO Box 6501 , Englewood, CO, 80155 303 397-3727  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 UTELAND BUTTE 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     2152 FNL 2067 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

8 /25 /2015

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 XTO Energy, Inc. performed an Acid Treatment on this well per the
following: 8/19/2015:. MIRU WLU. RIH w/ JDC & recover plngr fr/ Fclr
stop @ 10,920'. RDMO WLU SWI & SDFN. 8/21/2015: MIRU Cudd pmp
eqp. PT surface Lines. Start pumping on TCA w/ TFW @ 7 BPM. Brk circ
@ 40 bls ttl. Pump 48 bls 15% HCL w/ adds dwn TCA. Displace acid to

8100' FS. SI tbg Displace acid w/ 110 bls TFW. ( Btm perf ). SWI &
SDFWE. 8/24/2015: MIRU SWU #27. RU & RIH w/swb tls. S 0 BO, 15 BW,
4 run;s ( 1 hr ). SWI & SDFN. 8/25/2015: RU & RIH w/swb tls. S 0 BO, 90
BW, 9 run;s (4 hrs). Well KO flwg. Flwd well to prod tk for hr to unload
well. FTP 230 psig. SICP 530 psig. Turn well to sales @ 12:15 PM. Turn well over to prod. RDMO SWU. 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Tiffani Spinelli-Genovese 303 397-3677

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 9 /14 /2015

September 14, 2015

Sundry Number: 66104 API Well Number: 43047358390000Sundry Number: 66104 API Well Number: 43047358390000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-48380

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well STATE 1-32

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
XTO ENERGY INC 43047358390000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
PO Box 6501 , Englewood, CO, 80155 303 397-3727 Ext UTELANDBUTTE

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

2152 FNL 2067 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SENW Section: 32 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

/ ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/25/2015
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

XTO Energy, Inc. performed an Acid Treatment on this well per the Accepted by the
following: 8/19/2015:. MIRU WLU. RIH w/ JDC & recover plngr fr/ FcIr Utah Division of
stop @ 10,920'. RDMO WLU SWI & SDFN. 8/21/2015: MIRU Cudd pmp Oil, Gas and Mining

eqp. PT surface Lines. Start pumping on TCA w/ TFW @ 7 BPM. Brk circ FOR RECORD ONLY
@ 40 bls ttl. Pump 48 bls 15% HCL w/ adds dwn TCA. Displace acid to September 14, 2015

8100' FS. SI tbg Displace acid w/ 110 bls TFW. ( Btm perf ). SWI &
SDFWE. 8/24/2015: MIRU SWU #27. RU & RIH w/swb tls. S 0 BO, 15 BW,
4 run;s ( 1 hr ). SWI & SDFN. 8/25/2015: RU & RIH w/swb tls. S 0 BO, 90

BW, 9 run;s (4 hrs). Well KO flwg. Flwd well to prod tk for hr to unload
well. FTP 230 psig. SICP 530 psig. Turn well to sales @ 12:15 PM. Turn well over to prod. RDMO SWU.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Tiffani Spinelli-Genovese 303 397-3677 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 9/14/2015

RECEIVED: Sep. 14,


	APD-DRILL
	APD-WORKSHEET
	APD-APPROVAL
	SPUD
	SUNDRY-SPUD
	WCR
	SUNDRY-PxA
	OPERATOR-CHG

