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EOG Resources, Inc.

P.O. 1910
Vernal, UT 84078

February 5, 2004

Utah Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

RE: APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
STAGECOACH UNIT 81-18
NE/NE, SEC. 18, T9S, R22E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE NO.: BIA 14-20-462-447
UTE INDIAN TRIBAL LANDS

Enclosed please find a copy of the Application for Permit to Drill and associated
attachments for the referenced well.

Please address further communication regarding this matter (including approval) to:
Ed Trotter
P.O. Box 1910 RECVernal, UT 84078 EIVED
Phone: (435)789-4120 FEB12 20Fax: (435)789-1420

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MININGSincerely,

Ed Tro
Agent
EOG Resources, Inc.

Attachments

SCU 81-18



t Form,3160-3

FORMAPPROVED(August 1999) TED STATES
OMB NO. 1004-0136DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease serial No.BUREAU OF LANDMANAGEMENT

BIA 14-20-462-447ÛÛÎ APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER 6. If Indian, AnottecorTribe name
UTEINDIANTRIBEla. TYPEOFWORK E DRILL O REENTER
7. If Unitor CAAgreement, Nameand No.

STAGECOACH UNITb. TYPEOFWml 000 Wen GasWen O Other Ë SingleZone O MultipleZone
2. Name of Operator

8. Lease NameandWenNo.
EOGRESOURCES, INC.

STAGECOACHUNIT81-18
3a. Address

9. APIWellNo.P.O.BOX 1910, VERNAL, UT 8407g &¾> $ 6 93b.Telephone Number (435)789-4120
10. Field andpool, or Exploratory

NATURALBUTTES4. location of Well (Report locationclearly and in accordance with any State requirements *) 11. Sec.,T., R., M., or BLK. And survey of area
At surface ggg272' FNL& 228' FEL (go2x;y NE/NE SEC. 18, T9S, R22E,S.L.B.&M.At proposed prod, Zone

14. Distance in milesand directionfrom nearest town or postiffice*
12. Countyor parish -- 13. State15.21MILES SOUTHEAST OF OURAY,UTAH UINTAH UTAH

15. Distancefromproposed 16. No. of acres in lease 17. SpacingUnitdedicatedto thisweH
locationto nearest
propertyor lesseline, it 228' 160(Alsoto nearestdrig.Unitline,if any)

18. Distancefrompoposed location*
19. Proposeddepth 20. BLM/BIA BondNo.on file

to nearestwell,drilling,completed,
otapplied for,onthis lease, ft. See MapC 10,715' #22-000-4562L Elevations(show whetherDF, KDB, RT,GL,etc. 22. Approx. datework will start* 23. Estimated duration FEBf 2201)44763.9 FEET GRADED GROUND UPON APPROVAL DIVOEDIL,GAsa MINING24. Attachments

ThefollowinL completed in accordance with the requirements of OnshoreOilandGasOrderNo. 1, shallbe attachedto this form:1. Wellplat certifiedby a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to coverthe operations unlesscoveredbyan existing bond on file
2. A DrillingPlan

(seeitem 20 above).3. A SurfaceUsePlan (if the locationis on National Forest Systemlands,the 5. Operatorcertification.SUPO shall be flied with the appropriate Forest ServiceOffice. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by theAuthorized officer.
25. Signature

i Name (Printed/ Typed) Datefg i Ed Trotter February 5, 2004
roved r tu Í Name (PrintedOped) Date

, y , i BRADLEYG.HILLTîtie
oflSNVIRONMENTALSCIENTISTIII

Application approvaldoes not warrant or certify that the applicant holdslegal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which wouldentitletheapplicant to
conduct operationsthereon.
Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached.

Title18 U.S.C.Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its



RR T9S, R22E, S.L.B.¿cM. EOG RESOURCES, INC.
Ei ZË

Well location, STAGECOACH UNIT $81-18, locotedEE 272' as shown in the NE 1/4 NE 1/4 of Section 18,
73.69 - (G.L.O.) T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. Uintoh County, Utoh.

228, BASIS OF ELEVATION
I I 90 BENCH MARK 2OEAM LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION 35,

T STAGECOACH UN/T /81-18 '°
TSS, R21E, S.L B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE.LO 1
QUADRANGLE. UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.Elev. Ungraded Ground = 4765
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHEDBY THE UNITEDSTATES9, DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAIDo ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING4697 FEET.o

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGSIS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION,

o LOT 2

oTHE PROPOPSEDWELL HEAD BEARSLOT 3 S39°53'24"W 354.78' FROM THE
NOSRTHRE2ASTCORNER OF SECTION 18,

SCALE

CERTIF1CA L
THISIS TO CERT1FY THAT THE WAS' PREP EROMFIE1.0NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS ME OR UNDE MY
SUPERVISION AND THAT TNE SAM Ô THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND g :LOT 4

-a :

Set Stone, LAND SURVE10R
PNe of Stones REGI •NO, _1.E12' Mt Y STATE --otas at,can, 589'50'24"W - 4870,04' (Meos,)
'

,

REVISED: 09-10-03 D.COX L

'uf . Iree UINTAH ENGINEERING & I..AND SURVEYlNGPost 1 1 At Y

BS SOUTH 200 £AST - VßRNAL, UTAH 84078
(435) 789-1017

LEGEND:
, SCAI.E DATESURVEYED: OATEDRAM

1" = 1000' 06-23-03 07-03-03L_ = 90· SYMBOL
(NAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES

K.K M.B. D.COX G.LO. PLAT& = PROPOSED WELL HEAD- LATiTUDE= 40°02'33.18" (40.042550) '
A = SECTION CORNERSLOCATED. LONGITUDE= 109'28'24.42" (109.473450)

weAsuta
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002
United States Department of the Interior

BUREAUOF LANDMANAGEMENT
Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155
Balt Lake city, Utäh 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
(UT-922)

February 19, 2004

Memorandum

To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2004 Plan of Development Stagecoach Unit
Uintah County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management, the following wells are planned for calendar year
2004 within the Stagecoach Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ Blackhawl

43-047-35490 Stagecoach Unit 84-8 Sec 8 TO9S R22E 1786 FSL 1867 FWL
43-047-35492 Stagecoach Unit 81-18 Sec 18 TO9S R22E 0272 FNL 0228 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this
time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc: File - Stagecoach Unit
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron



EIGHT POINT PLAN

STAGECOACH UNIT 81-18
NE/NE, SEC. 18,T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION DEPTH (KB)
Green River FM 1,637'
Wasatch 6,327'
Island 7,547'
KMV. Price River 7,807'
KMV Middle Price River 8,507'
KMV Lower Price River 9,367'
Bit Trip Sego 9,777'
Sego 9,837'
KlüV Castlegate 9,947'
Base Castlegate SS 10,180'
Bit Trip Black Hawk Shale 10,202'
KMV Black Hawk 10,377'

EST. TD: 10,715 Anticipated BHP 4600 PSI

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: 5000 PSIG BOP Schematic Diagrams attached.4. CASINGPROGRAM:
RATING FACTORHOLE SIZE INTERVAL LENGTH & WEIGHT GRADE THREAD COLLAPSE BURST TENSILE12 1/4" O'-250' 250' 9 5/8" 36.0# J55 STC 2020 PSI 3520 PSI 394,000#8 3/4" 250' - 4000'+/- KB 4000' +/- 7" 23.0 # 155 STC 3270 PSI 4360 PSI 313,000#6 1/4" 4000' - TD +/-KB 10,715' +/- 4 1/2" 11.6 # NSO LTC 6350 PSI 7780 PSI 223,000#

The 8 ¾" Intermediate hole will be drilled to a totaldepth of 200' belowthe baseof the GreenRiver lostcirculation zone and 7" casing will be set to thatdepth. Actual settingdepthof the 7" casing may be less than4000' in this well.

All casing will benew or inspected.

5. Float Equipment:
Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Insert Baffle
Wooden wiper plug
Centralizers: 1 - 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints(4 total).

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'-4000')
Float Shoe: (PDC drillable)
Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Centralizers: 1-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5* jointto surface (15 total.)

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

STAGECOACH UNIT 81-18
NE/NE,SEC.18, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY,UTAH

Float Eauipment (Continued):
Production Hole Procedure (4000'-TD'):
FS, 1 jointof casing, FC, and balanceof casing to surface. Run 11.6#, N-80 burst rating or equivalent
marker collars or short casing jointsat ± 7,810' (Top of Price River) and ± 5,900' (400' above the
Wasatch) (alter depth if needed to avoid placing across any potentially- productive intervals).
Centralize 5' above shoeon joint #1, top of joint#2, thenevery 2nd jointto ± 400' above Island top (50total). Threadlock FS, top and bottom of FC, and top of 2nd

jOißt.

6. MUDPROGRAM

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'below GL):
Air - Air Water Mist

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'-4000'):
Spud - 5000': Circulate fresh water throughreserve pit and add Crystal Drill. Sweep with Barazan D

and Barolift s .

5000'- 9000': Close in pits and add 6 ppb DAP. AddCrystal Drill to keep water clear. Add NaCl water
for weight. Sweep with Barazan D andBarolift

9000' - TD: Close in pits and add 6 ppb DAP. Add Crystal Drill to keep waterclear. Add bariteforweight. Add sea mud for viscosity as needed. Sweep with Barazan D and Barolift

Production Hole Procedure (4000'-TD):
Spud - 5000': Circulatefresh water throughreserve pit and add Crystal Drill. Sweep with Barazan D

and Barolift

5000'- 9000': Close in pits and add 6 ppb DAP. Add Crystal Drill to keep water clear. Add NaCl waterfor weight. Sweep withBarazan D and Barolift

9000' - TD: Close in pits and add 6 ppb DAP. Add Crystal Drill to keep water clear. Add barite for
weight. Add sea mud for viscosity as needed. Sweep with Barazan D and Barolift

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:
A. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring a straight run blooie line (Where

possible, a straight run blooie line will be used).

B. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring an automatic ignitor or
continuous pilot light on the blooie line. (Not required on aerated water system).

C. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.To reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be 75' in length.

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

STAGECOACHUNIT 81-18
NE/NE, SEC. 18, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH

8. EVALUATIONPROGRAM:
Logs: RST (Reservoir SaturationTool) cased hole logs TD - Surface

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'Below GL)
Lead: 150 sx. (100% excessvolume) Class 'G' cement with 2% S001 (CaC12)& 0.25 pps D29

(cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.16 cu. ft./sk.,4.95 gps water.

Top Out: Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) in mix water, 15.8 ppg, 1.16 cu. ft./sk.,
4.95 gps via 1" tubingset at 25' if needed

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'-4000'):
Lead: 170 sks. (50% excess volume) Class 'G' lead cement with 5% D44 (Salt), 12% D20 (Bentonite),1% D79% (Extender), 0.25% Dl12 (Fluid LossAdditive), 0.2% D46 (Anti-Foamer) & 0.25 ppsD29 (Cellophane flakes) mixed at 1LOppg, 3.91 cu.ft/sk., 24.54 gps water. -·

-

Tail: 145 sks. (50% excessvolume) 59:50 Poz Class "G" cement with 10% DS3 (BWOW), mixed at14.2 ppg, 1.59cu.ft./sk., 7.91 gps water.

Production Hole Procedure (4000' to TD)
Lead: 315 sks: 35:65 Poz: Class "G" w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite), + 2% D174 + 0.75% Dl12 + 0.2% D46+0.15% Dl3 + 0.25pps D29, mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.74 cu.ft/sk., 9.05 gps water.

Tail: 490 sks: 50:50 Poz: Class "G" w/ 2% D020(Bentonite), + 0.1% D46 + 0.075% D13 + 0.2% D167+ 0.2% D65, mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.30 cu.ft/sk., 6.09 gps water.

10. ABNORMALCONDITIONS:
Intermediate Hole (250'-4000'):
Lost circulation, asphaltic,blackoil, Trona water flowsand significant gas-bearing zones may beencountered in the Green River, beginning at 1,637'.

Production Hole (4000'-TD):
Sloughing shales and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch Formation. CO2 contaminationin the mud is possible in the Price River (Mesa Verde).

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

STAGECOACH UNIT 81-18
NE/NE,SEC. 18, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.& M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. ChokeManifold
B. KellyCock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title IH in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 poundswill be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.Furthermore, no extremely hazardoussubstances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,will be used, produced, stored, transported,or disposedof in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG



O O
CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL

FOR THE SURFACE USEPROGRAM OF THE
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: EOG Resources,Inc.
Well Name & Number: StagecoachUnit 81-18
Lease Number: BIA 14-20-462-447
Location: 272' FNL & 228' FEL, NE/NE, Sec. 18,

T9S, R22E, S.LB.&M., Uintah County
Surface Ownership: Ute Indian Tribe

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

LocationConstruction - forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction
of location and access roads,

Location Completion - prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Spud Notice: - at least twenty-four(24) hours prior to'
spudding the well.

CasingStringand
Cementing

.

- twenty-four(24) hoursprior to running
casing and cementing all casing strings.

BOP and related
Equipment Tests - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and tests.

FirstProduction
Notice - within five (5) businessdaysafter new

Well beginsor production resumes after
Wellhasbeenoff production for more
than ninety (90) days.

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of
Approval for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

SCU 81-18 D
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THIRTEEN POINT SURFACE USE PROGRAM

1. EXISTING ROADS

A. See attached Wellsite Plats showingdirectional reference stakes on location,
and attached TOPO Map "B" showing access to location fromexisting roads.

B. The proposed well site is locatedapproximately 15.21 miles southeast of
Ouray, Utah - See attached TOPO Map "A".

C. Refer to attachedTopographic Map "A" showing labeled access route to
location.

D. Existing roads willbe maintainedand repaired as necessary. No off lease
Right-of-Way will be required.

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROAD

A. The access road will be approximately 50 feet in length. See attached TOPO
Map "B".

B. The access roadhas a 30 foot ROWw/ 18 footrunning surface.
C. Maximum gradeon access road will be 8%.
D. No turnoutswillbe required.
E. Road drainagecrossings shall be of the typicaldrycreek drainagecrossing

type.
F. One 18" CMP culvert will be installed in the access road.
G. The access roadwill be dirt surface.
H. No gates, cattleguards, or fences will be required or encountered.

New or reconstructed roads will be centerlined - flaggedat time of location
staking.

All travelwill be confined to existing access road Right-of-Way.
Access roads and surface disturbingactivities will conform to standards outlined
in the Bureau of Land Management and Forest Service Publication: Surface
Operating Standards For Oil & Gas Exploration and Development, (1989).

The road shall be upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated traffic flow
and all-weather road requirements. Upgrading shall include ditching, drainage, graveling,
crowning, and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well-constructed safe road.
Prior to upgrading, the road shall be cleared of any snow cover and allowed to dry
completely. Traveling off the 30 foot Right-of-Waywill not be allowed.

Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing type.
Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause siltation or accumulation of debris in
the drainage crossings nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Erosion of

SCU 81-18 D



O O
drainageditches by run off water shall be prevented by diverting water off at frequent
intervals by means of cutouts. Upgrading shall not be allowedduring muddy conditions.
Should mud holesdevelop, they shall be filledin and detoursaround themavoided.

As operator, EOGResources,Inc. shall be responsiblefor all maintenance on
cattleguards, or gates associated with thisoil and/or gas operation.

3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A ONE MILE RADIUS OF
PROPOSED WELL LOCATION

A. Abandoned wells - 4*
B. Producing wells - 20*

(*See attached TOPO map "C" for location)

4. LOCATION OF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED FACILITIES

A. ON WELL PAD

l. Production facilities will be set on location if the well is successfully
completed for production. Facilities will consist of well head valvés,
separator, dehy, 210Bbl condensate tank,meter house, and attached
piping.

2. Gasgathering lines - A 4" gathering line will be buriedfromdehyto
the edge of thelocation.

B. OFF WELL PAD

1. Proposed locationof attendant off pad flowlinesshall be flagged prior
to archaeological clearance.

2. A 4" OD steel above ground natural gas pipeline will be laid
approximately 518' from proposed location to a point in the NE/NE of
Section 18, T9S, R22E, where it will tie intoQuestarPipeline Co.'s
existing line. Proposed pipeline crosses BIA administered lands, thus
a Right-of -Waygrant will be required.

3. Proposed pipeline will bea 4" OD steel, welded line laid on the
surface.

4. Protective measures and devices for livestock and wildlife will be
takenand/or installed where required.

If storage facilities/tank batteriesare constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the well pad shall be surrounded by a containment dike
of sufficient capacity to contain, at a minimum, the entire contents of the
largest tank within the facility/battery, unless more stringent protective
requirements are deemednecessary bythe authorized officer.

SCU 81-18 D
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Theproductionfacilitieswill be placedon the Northeastside of the
location.

All permanent (on site for six months or longer)structures constructed or
installed(includingpumping units)will be painted a flat,non-reflective,
earthtone color to match one of the standard environmental colors, as
determined by the RockyMountain Five State InteragencyCommittee.
All facilitiesrequired will be painted within 6 months of installation.
Facilitiesrequired to comply withO.S.H.A. (Occupational Safety and
Health Act) will be excluded.
The required paint color is CarlsbadCanyon.
If at any timethe facilities locatedon public land and authorizedby the
termsof the lease are no longer included in the lease(due to a construction
in the unit or other lease or unit boundary change), the BIA will process a
changein authorization to the appropriate rental or other financial
obligation as determined by the authorized officer.

5. LOCATION & TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

A. Water supply will be fromthe OurayBrinePlant at Ouray, Utah, and/or Target
Trucking Inc.'s water source in theSW/SW, Sec.35, T9S, R22E,Uintah
County, Utah(StateWaterRight#49-1501).Produced water fromtheChapita
Wellsand Stagecoach Unitswill alsobe used.

B. Waterwill be hauledby a licensedtruckingcompany.
C. No waterwell will be drilledon lease.

6. SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL

A. All construction materialfor this location and access road will be of native
borrowand soil accumulated duringthe construction of the location.

B. All construction materialwill come fromTribalLand.
C. No mineralmaterialswill be required.

7. METHODS OF HANDLING WASTE DISPOSAL

A. METHODS AND LOCATION
1. Cuttings will be confined in the reserve pit.
2. A portable toilet will be provided for human waste during the drilling

and completion of the well. Disposal will be at the Vernal sewage
disposal plant.

3. Burning will not be allowed. Trashand other waste material will be
contained in a wire mesh cage and disposed of at the Uintah County
landfill.

4. Produced wastewater will be confined to a lined pit or storage tank for
a period not to exceed 90 days after initial production. After the 90
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dayperiod, theproduced waterwill be contained in a tankon location
and then disposedof at one of the followingthree locations: Natural
ButtesUnit21-20BSWD, Ace Disposal, or EOG Resources, Inc.
drillingoperations (Chapita Wells Unit,Natural Buttes Unit &
StagecoachUnit).

5. All chemicals will be disposedof at an authorized disposal site. Drip
pans and absorbent pads will be used on the drillingrig to avoid
leakageof oil to thepit.

B. Water from drillingfluidsand recovered duringtestingoperations will be
disposed of by either evaporating in the reserve pit or be removed and
disposed of at an authorized disposalsite. Introduction of well bore
hydrocarbons to the reserve pit will be avoided by flaring them off in the flare
pit at the timeof recovery.

On BIA administered land:
The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak,break, or allow discharge.
If the reserve pit requires padding prior to lining(dueto rocky conditions) felt
padding will beused.

The reserve pit shall be lined with a plastic liner. A felt liner will also be
installed if rock is encountered during pit construction.

8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES
A. No airstrips or camps areplanned forthis well.

9. WELLSITE LAYOUT
A. Refer to attachedwell siteplat for related topographycuts and fills and

cross sections.
B. Refer toattached well siteplat for rig layoutand soil material stockpile

location as approved on On-site.
C. Refer to attached well siteplat for rig orientation, parking areas, and

access road.

The reserve pit will be located on the Northwest corner of the location.
The flarepit will be located downwind of the prevailing wind directionon
the North side of the location, a minimum of 100 feet from the well head
and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.
The stockpiled topsoilwill be stored from Southeast of Corner #7 to
Southwest of Corner #6.

Access to the well pad will be from the Southwest.

SCU 81-18 D
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FENCING REQUIREMENTS:

All pits will be fencedaccordingto the following minimumstandards:

A. Thirty-nine inchnet wire shall be used withat least one strand of barbed wire
on top of the net wire. (Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of
reinforcement rod is attached to the top of the entire fence).

B. The net wire shall be no more than 2 inches above the ground. The barbed
wire strand shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence
shall be at least42 inches.

C. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or bracedin such a manner as to keep the
fence tightat all times.

D. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shallbe used betweenthe corner braces.
Maximumdistancebetweenany two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

E. All wire shall be stretched by using a stretching device before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencingwill be on the threesides during drilling operations and on
the fourthside when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and

.

maintaineduntil cleanup.

Each existing fenceto be crossed bythe access road shall be bracedand tied off
beforecutting so as to prevent slackingof thewire. The opening shall be closed
temporarilyas necessary during construction to prevent the escape of livestock,
and, uponcompletion of construction, the fenceshall be repaired to BIA or SMA
specifications. A cattleguard with an adjacent 16-foot gate shall be installed in
any fence where a road is to be regularly traveled. If the well is a producer, the
cattleguards (shall/shall not) be permanently mounted on concrete bases. Prior to
crossing anyfencelocated on Triballand, or any fencebetween Tribal land and
private land,the operator will contact the BIA,who will in turn contact the
grazing permittee or owner of said fence and offer him/her the opportunity to be
present when the fenceis cut in order to satisfy himself/herselfthat the fence is
adequatelybracedand tied off.

10. PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE

A. PRODUCING LOCATION
Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing,equipment, debris,materials, trash, and junknot
required for production.
Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be

removed in accordance with CFR3162.7-1.
If a plastic nylon reinforced liner is used, it shall be torn and perforated before
backfilling of the reserve pit.

SCU 81-18 D
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The reserve pit and thatportion of the location not needed for production
facilitiesloperationswill be recontoured to the approximate natural contours.
The reserve pit will be reclaimed within 12months fromthe date of well
completion. Before any dirt work takesplace, the reserve pit will be
completely dryandall cans, barrels,pipe, fluid, and hydrocarbons,will be
removed.

Contact appropriate surface management agency for required seed mixture.

B. DRY HOLE/ABANDONED LOCATION

At such timeas the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator
will submit a subsequent report of abandonmentand the BIA will
attach the appropriatesurface rehabilitation conditions of approvaL

11. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
Access road: Tribal
Location: Tribal

12. OTHER INFORMATION
A. EOG Resources, Inc.will informall persons in the area who are associated

with thisprojectthat theyare subject to prosecution forknowinglydisturbing
historicor archaeological sites,or for collecting artifacts. If historicor
archaeological materials are uncovered duringconstruction, the operator will
immediatelystop work thatmight furtherdisturbsuch materials, and contact
the AO. Withinfiveworking daysthe AO will inform the operator as to:

-whether the materials appear eligible for the NationalRegisterof
HistoricPlaces;

-the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake before
the site can be used.

-a time frame for theAO to complete an expedited review under 36 CFR
800.11 to confirm, throughthe State Historic Preservation Officer, that
the findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation is appropriate.

If the operator wished, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the
expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with this process, the
AO will assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization
of the exposed materials thatmay be required. Otherwise, the operator
will be responsible for mitigation costs.
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The AO will provide technicalandprocedural guidelines for the conduct
of mitigation. Upon verification from the AO that required mitigationhas
beencompleted, the operator will then be allowed to resume construction.

B. As operator, EOG Resources,Inc. will control noxious weeds
along Right-of-Ways for roads, pipelines, well sites, or other applicable
facilities. A list of noxious weeds will be obtained from the BIA,or the
appropriate County Extension Office. On BIA administered land,a Pesticide
Use proposal shall be submitted, and given approval, prior to the application
of herbicides or other pesticides orpossible hazardous chemicals.

C. Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this well site
will not be stacked or stored on Tribal Lands after the conclusionof drilling
operations or at any othertime without BIA authorization. However, if BIA
authorization is obtained, it is only a temporarymeasureto allow time to make
arrangements for permanent storage on commercial facilities. (The BIA does
not seek to compete with private industry. There are commercial facilities
available for stacking and storing drillirig rigs.)

Additional Surface Stipulations
None

LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION

PERMITTING AGENT DRILLING OPERATIONS
Ed Trotter Donald Presenkowski
P.O. Box 1910 EOG Resources, Inc.
Vernal, UT 84078 P.O. Box 250
Telephone: (435)789-4120 Big Piney, WY 83113
Fax: (435)789-1420 Telephone: (307)276-4865

All lease or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full
compliance is madewith all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas
Orders,the approval plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.
EOG Resources, Inc. is fully responsible for the actions of their subcontractors. A
copy of these conditions will be furnished to the field representative to insure
compliance.

A copy of the approved APD and ROW grant, if applicable, shall be on location
duringconstruction of the location and drilling activities.

The BIA office shall be notified upon site completion prior to moving on the
drillingrig.

SCU 81-18 D
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Certification

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my directsupervision, have inspected the
proposed drillsiteand access route; that I am familiarwith the conditions that presently
exist; that thestatements made in the Planare, to the bestof my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by EOGResources, Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this Plan and the termsand conditions under which it is approved.

Please be advisedthatEOG Resources,Inc. is considered to be the operator of the
Stagecoach 81-18 Well, located in the NEINESection 18, TS9, R22E, Uintah County,
Utah; Lease #BIA 14-20-462-447; and is responsible under the terms and conditions of
the lease for the operations conducted upon the leased lands. Bond Coverage is provided
under Bond #22-000-456.

Date Agent

SCU 81-18 D
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EOG RESOURCES,INC.

STAGECOACHUNIT#81-18
SECTION18,T9S, R22E,S.L.B.&M.

PROCEEDIN A WESTERLYDIRECTIONFROM VERNAL, UTAH ALONG U.S.HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY14.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATEHIGHWAY 88; EXIT LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLYDIRECTIONAPPROXIMATELY17.0 MILESTO OURAY,UTAH;PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLYDIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0 3 MILES ON THE SEEPRIDGEROADTO THEJUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTINGROAD TO THE EAST; TURNLEFT AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY12.3MILES TO THE JUNCTIONOF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTINGROAD TO THESOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTIONAPPROXIMATELY 1.3 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND ANEXISTINGROAD TO THE WEST; TURN RIGHTANDPROCEED IN A WESTERLYDIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.4 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROADAND AN EXISTINGROAD TO THE SOUTHWEST;TURN LEFTAND)ROCEEÛIN A SOUTHWESTERLY, THEN NORTHWESTERLY DIRECTIONAPPROXIMATELY0.9 MILESTO THE BEGINNINGOF THEPROPOSED ACCESSTO THE NORTHEAST; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN A NORTHEASTERLYDIRECTIONAPPROXIMATELY50' TO THEPROPOSED LOCATION.
TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELLLOCATION IS APPROXIMATELY 46.2





LOCATIONLAYOUT FOR
STAGECOACH UNIT #81-18

SECTION 18, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
272'FNL 228'FEL
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EOG RESOURCES, INC. mn,
o TYPICALCROSS SECTIONSFOR

X-secti°" STAGECOACH UNIT #81-18 -

scale SECTlON 18, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M. ÑÌ..No.161319 . o

1" =
50, 272' FNL 228° FEL i'. ROBE

DATE: 09-10-03 '.
Drawn By D,COX

65' 125'
Preconstruction '
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STA. J+25

126' 125°

LOCAT/0N STAKE
CUT CUT
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/LL
FILL

c
111 STA. 0+18

126' 125'

Finished Grade
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STA 0+00
APPROXIMATEYARDAGES

EXCESSMATERIALAFTER
(12") Topsoil Stripping = 2,740 Co. Yds. S% COMPACTl0N = 4,400 Cu. Yds.

Topsoil & Pit Bockfill = 4,400 Cu. Yds.Remaining Location = 4,240 Cu. Yds.
(1/2 Pit Vol.)

TOTAL CUT = 6,980 CU.YDS. EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu, Yds.
(After Rehabilitation)

FILL = 2,450 CU.YDS.
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINC
85 So. 200 East • Verrlal, Utah 84078 * (435)
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PROPOSED LOCATION: C 1. M . N-
STAGECOACH UNIT #81-18
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LEGEND: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
PROPOSED LOCATION N STAGECOACH UNIT #81-18

SECTION 18, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.
272' FNL 228' FEL

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I c 06 27 0385 South 2OO East Vernal. ITtah 84078 p(435) 789-1011 * FAX (435) 189-1813 MO ÐAY YEAR
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5000 PSIG DIAGRAM

ANNULAR PREVENTOR AND BOTH RAMS ARE 5000 PSIG RATED.
CASING FLANGE IS 11" 5000 PSIG RATED. ROTATING HEAD
BOPE 11" 5000 PSIG

TESTING PROCEDURE: FLOW LINE
1. BOPE's will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2 ( )

with retest every 14 days.
2. Blind & Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 5000 psig. I I
3. Annular preventor will be testedto 50% of working pressure, 2500 psig.
4. Casing will be tested to 0.22 psilft or 2500 psig. Not to exceed 70% of burst

strength, whichever is greater. PREVENTER
5. All lines subject to well pressure will be pressure-tested to the same pressure as

blind & pipe rams.
6. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2

requirements for 5000 psig BOPE specifications.

PIPE RAMS
CHOKE MANIFOLD

2" MIN ADJUSTABLE CHOKE

o O 0H
TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR
OR PIT BLIND RAMS

A 3" MINIMUM RATED O i
5000 PSIG

3" MINIMUM 2" KILL LINE

BLEED LINE TO PIT 3" DIAMETER

CASING
2" MINIMUM LANG

SPOOL 11" 5000 PSIG

TO MUDIGAS SEPARATOR ADJUSTABLE CHOKE
OR
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004 ÁPPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL'

APD RECEIVED: 02/12/2004 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-35492

WELL NAME: STAGECOACH U 81-18

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC ( N9550 )

CONTACT: ED TROTTER PHONE NUMBER: 435-789-4120

PROPOSED LOCATION:

NENE 18 090s 220E INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SURFACE: 0272 FNL 0228 FEL Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 0272 FNL 0228 FEL

UINTAH Engineering

NATURAL BUTTES ( 630 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 2 - Indian Surface
LEASE NUMBER: 14-20-462-447

SURFACE OWNER: 2 - Indian
LATITUDE: 40.04255

PROPOSED FORMATION: BLKHK

COALBED METHANE WELL? NO LONGITUDE: 109.47357

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

V Plat R649-2-3.

y/' Bond: Fed[] Ind[2] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit STAGECOACH

DRo. 22-000-456 )
Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Otr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
Uso.49-1501 )

Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No: ) J(Date: ) e

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) i

il3 e

JwaÁÍ «

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS;
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OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCESINC (N9550)

SEC. 18 T.9S, R.22E

FIELD:NATURAL BUTTES (630)
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MICHAEL O. LEAVlTT

OLENE S. WALKER
Lieutenant Governor

rose

State of Utah February 19, 2004

Department of
Natural Resources

Division of EOGResources, Inc.
Oil, Gas & Mining PO Box 1910

Vernal, UT 84078
ROBERT L MORGAN

Erecutive Director

LOWELL P. BRAXTUN Re: Stagecoach Unit 81-18 Well, 272' FNL, 228' FEL, NE NE, Sec. 18, T. 9 Southomsonverector
R. 22 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-35492.

rely,

ohn R. Baza
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Buteau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

1594WestNorth Temple,Suite 1210,PO Box 145801,Salt LakeCity,UT 84114-5801 e
telepbone (801)538-5340•facsimile (801)359-3940•TTY (801)538-7223•www.ogen.uraagov Where ideas
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Operator: EOGResources, Inc.
WellName & Number Stagecoach Unit 81-18

API Number: 43-047-35492
Lease: BIA 14-20-462-447

Location: NE NE Sec._.1_8_ T. 9 South R. 22 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisionsof the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify theDivision within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Porm 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weeldy Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. In accordance with Order in Cause No. 190-5(b) dated October 28, 1982, the Operator shall
comply with requirements of Rules R649-3-31 and R649-3-27 pertaining to Designated
Oil Shale Areas. Additionally, the operator shall ensure that the surface and/or
production casing is properly cemented over the entire oil shale interval as defined by
Rule R649-3-31. The Operator shall report the actual depth the oil shale is encountered
to the Division.

5. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to



Form3160-3

D STATES F°EUAPŸROVED
OMSNO. 1004-0136DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease serialNo,BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT

BIA 14-20-462-447APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER 6. If Indian, A))otteeor Tribe name
UTE INDIAN TRIBEla. TYPEOF WORK DRILL O REENTER
7. If Unitor CA Agreement, Nameand No.

STAGECOACH UNITb. TYPE OF WELL OH Wen GasWell O Other Single Zone O MultipleZone
2. Name of Operator

8. lase Nameand WellNo.
EOG RESOURCES, INC.

STAGECOACHUNIT81-18
3a. AddreSS

9. API Weu No.P.O. BOX 1910, VERNAL, UT 84078 ggg¢y ggg3b.TelephoneNumber: (435)789-4120
10, Field and pool, or Exploratory

NATURAL BUTTES4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or BLK. And survey of area
Atsurface

272' FNL& 228' FEL NE/NE SEC. 18, T9S, R22E, S.L.B.&M.Atproposedprod. Zone

14. Distance in miles anddirection fromnestest townor post office*
12. County or parish -. 13. State15.21 MILES SOUTHEAST OF OURAY,UTAH UINTAH UTAH

15. Distancefromproposed 16. No. of acres ín lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to thiswell
location to nearest
propertyor leaseline, a 228' 160(Also to nearest drig. Unitline, if any)

18. Distancefrom proposed location*
19. Proposed depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file

to nearestwell,drilling,completed,
or applied for, on this lease, ft. See Map c 10,715' #22-000-45621. Elevations(show whetherDF, KDB, RT,GL, etc. 22. Approx. dateworkwillstart* 23. Estimated duration
4763.9 FEET GRADEDGROUND UPON APPROVAL

24. Attachments
The following, completed in accordance withthe requirements of OnshoreOiland GasOrder No. 1, shall be attached to thisform:1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bondto cover theoperations unless covered by an existingbond on file

2. A Drilling Plan
(see item 20 above).3. A Surface Use Plan(if the location ison National ForestSystemlands,the 5. Operatorcertification.SUPO shall be filedwith the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by theAuthorized officer.

25. Signature
Name (Printed/ Typed) Date//4/ Ed Trotter February 5, 2004

NOsme(Printed/Typed) te

Application approval does not warrantor certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to thoserights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to
conduct operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title43 U.S.C. Section1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any d g the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
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Well No.: SCU 81-18

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.

Well Name & Number: SCU 81-18

Lease Number: 1420-462-447

API Number: 43-047-35492

Location: NENE Sec. ] T.9_S_R. 22E

Agreement: Stage Coach Unit

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval
for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that theapplicant holds legal or equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well is
being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

A. DRILLING PROGRAM

1. Estimated Depth at Which Oil, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearing Zones are Expected
to be Encountered

Report ALL water shows and water-bearing sands to John Mayers of this office prior to setting
the next easing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies of State of Utah form
OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected, submit samples to this office
along with any water analyses conducted.

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLM at onsite)
encountered during drilling, will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas
shows will be tested to determine commercial
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Well No.: SCU 81-18

2. Pressure Control Equipment

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas
Order No. 2 forequipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc., for a BM system and
individual components shall be operable as designed. Chart recorders shall be used for all
pressure tests.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while drilling
and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

3. Casing Program and Auxiliary Equipment

Surface casing shall have centralizers on the bottom three joints,with a minimum of one
centralizer per joint. Surface casing setting depths are based on ground level elevations only.

All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressure testedto 0.22 psilft of casing string
length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater but not to exceed 70% of the minimum internal yield.

As a minimum requirement, the cement behind to production casing must extend at least
200' above the top of the Wasatch Formation which has been identified at ±5000'

If gilsonite is encountered while drilling, it shall be isolated and/or protected via the cementing
program.

4. Mud Program and Circulating Medium

Hazardous substances specifically listed by the EPA as a hazardous waste or demonstrating a
characteristic of a hazardous waste will not be used in drilling, testing,or completion operations.

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and Indian lands without prior
BLM approval to ensure adequate protection of fresh water aquifers.

5. Coring, Logging and Testing Program

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to this office on a weekly basis.

A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to top of the cement and
shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing. Submit a field copy of
the CBL to this office.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30 days after
completion of thewell or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with
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Well No.: SCU 81-18

CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data, geologic
summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled during the
drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, will be filed with Form 3160-4. Samples
(cuttings, fluids, and/or gases) will be submitted when requested by the AO.

Please submit to this office, in LAS format, an electronic copy of all logs run on this well
This submission will replace the requirement for submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

6. Notifications of Operations

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment will be removed froma well to be placed in a suspended status without prior approval
of the AO. If operations are to be suspended, prior approval of the AOwill be obtained and
notification given before resumption of operations.

Operator shall report production data to MMS pursuant to 30 CFR 216.5 using form MMS/3160.

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual occurrences
shall be promptly reported in accordance with the requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "SundryNotice" (Form 3160-5)
to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved plan
are applicable duringall operations conducted with the replacement rig.

The date on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for oil wells as the
date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporary storage facility,
such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or, the date on which
liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent storage facility, whichever first occurs;
and, for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped
from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be
generated or, the date on which gas is first measured through permanent metering facilities,
whichever first occurs.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will be notified when the well
is placed in a producing status. Written notification of such must be submitted to this office not
later than five (5} days following the date on which the we11is placed on production.

Gas produced from this well may not be vented or flared beyond an initial authorized test period
of 30 days or 50 MMCF following its completion, whichever occurs first, without the prior
written approval of the Authorized Officer. Should gas be vented or flared without approval
beyond the authorized test period, the operator may be directed to shut-in the well until the gas
can be captured or approval to continue venting or flaring as uneconomic is granted and
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Well No.: SCU 81-18

operator shall be required to compensate the lessor for that portion of the gas vented or flared
without approval which is determined to have been avoidably lost.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5(d) shall be submitted to the
appropriate Field Office within 60 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs first.
All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be adhered to.
All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tankswill be effectively sealed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (1).

No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior approval of the AO. In
the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergencies, oral approval will be obtained
from the AO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be filed with theAO
within thirty (30) days following completion of the well for abandonment. This report will
indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Final
abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by the approved
APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the AOor his
representative, or the appropriate SurfaceManaging Agency.

7. Other Information

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling onlease or off-lease will have prior
written approval from the AO.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location. The oil and gas
meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries and testedfor meter accuracy at least
quarterly thereañer. The AO will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will
be submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform with
Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 5 for
natural gas measurement.

The use of materials under BLM jurisdictionwill conform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover program without prior
approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. All wells,
whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned will be identified in accordance with 43
CFR 3162.
"Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for approval for all changes of
plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982, as implemented
by the applicable provisions of the operating regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(c), requires
that "not later than the 5th business day after any well begins production on which royalty is
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Well No.: SCU 81-18

anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site, or resumes production in the case of a well

which has been off production formore than 90 days, the operator shall notify the authorized
officer by letter or sundry notice, Form 3160-5, or orally to be followed by a letter or sundry
notice, of the dateon which such production has begun or resumed."

If you fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time allowed, you shall be liable
for a civil penalty of up to $10,000per violation for each day such violation continues, not to
exceed a maximum of 20 days. See Section 109(c)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty
Management Act of 1982 and the implementing regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(ii).

APD approval is valid for a period of one (1) year from the signature date. An extension period
may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Ed Forsman (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435)
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Well No.: SCU 81-18

EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPT EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, they are not necessarily hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids

Gas plant cooling towercleaning wastes

Painting wastes

Oil and gas service company wastes, such as empty drums, drum rinsate, vacuum truck rinsate,

sandblast media, painting wastes, spend solvents, spilled chemicals, and waste acids

Vacuum truck and drum rinsate from trucks and drums, transporting or containing nonexempt

waste

Refinery wastes

Liquid and solid wastes generated by crude oil and tank bottom reclaimers

Used equipment lubrication oils

Waste compressor oil, filters, and blowdown

Used hydraulic fluids

Waste solvents

Waste in transportation pipeline-related pits

Caustic or acid cleaners

Boiler cleaning wastes

Boiler refractory bricks

Incinerator ash

Laboratory wastes

Sanitary wastes

Pesticide wastes

Radioactive tracer wastes

Drums, insulation and miscellaneous
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Well No.: SCU 81-18

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

EOG Resources, Inc. (EOG) will assure the Ute Tribe that any/all contractors and subcontractors
have acquired a current Tribal Business License and have updated "Access Permits" prior to
construction. All EOGpersonnel, contractors and subcontractors will have thesepermits in their
vehicles at all times. Companies thathave not complied with this COA will be in violation of
theUte Tribal Business License Ordinance, and will be subject to fines and penalties.

EOG employees, representatives, and/or authorized personnel (subcontractors) shall not carry
firearms on their person or in theirvehicles while working on the Uintah and Ouray Indian
Reservation.

EOG employees and/or authorized personnel (subcontractors) in the field will have approved
applicable APDs and/or ROW permits/authorizations on theirperson(s) during all phases of
construction.

EOG will notify theUte Tribe and Bureau of Indian Affairs (BIA) in writing of any requested
modification of APDs or Rights-Of Way (ROW). EOG shall receive written notification of
authorization or denial of the requested modification. Without authorization, EOG will be
subject to fines and penalties.

The Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Department shall be notified in writing 48 hours in advance of
any construction activity. The Ute Tribal office is open Monday throughThursday. A Tribal
Technician is to routinely monitor construction. EOG shall make arrangements with the Ute
Energy & Minerals Department for all monitoring that will exceed regular working hours for
Tribal Technicians. A qualified archaeologist accompanied by a Tribal Technician will monitor
any trenching construction of thepipeline.

A ROW, 30 feet wide and 5 feet long, shall be granted by BIA for the new access road. A
corridor ROW, 30 feet wide and 51 feet long, shall be granted for the pipeline construction.
The constructed, travel width of the access road will be limited to 18 feet. Upon authorization by
the Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Department, the ROW may be wider where sharp curves; deep
cuts and fills occur; or, where intersections with other roads are required.

Culverts and diversion ditches will be placed and constructed where needed. Road base gravel
will be used where sandy soils make roadways and the drilling location hazardous for access or
drilling operations.

Upon completion of the pertinent APD and ROWs, EOG will notify the Ute Tribe Energy &
Minerals Department for a Tribal Technician to verify the Affidavit of Completion.

Production waters, oil, and other byproducts shall not be placed on access roads or the well
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Well No.: SCU 81-18

All vehicular traffic, personnel movement, construction and restoration operations will be
confined to the areas examined and approved and to the existing roadways and/or evaluated
access routes.

EOG will implement "Safety and Emergency Plan" and ensure plan compliance.

EOG shall stop construction activities and notify personnel from the Ute Tribe Energy &
Minerals Department and BIA if cultural remains including paleontology resources (vertebrate
fossils) are exposed or identified duringconstruction. The Ute Tribe Department of Cultural
Rights and Protection and the BIA will provide mitigation measures prior to allowing
construction.

EOG employees and/or authorized personnel (subcontractors) will not be allowed to collect
artifacts and paleontology fossils. No significant cultural resources shall be disturbed.

EOG will control noxious weeds on the well site and ROWs. EOG will be responsible for
noxious weed control if weeds spread from the project area onto adjoining land.

Reserve pits will be lined with an impervioussynthetic liner. A fence will be constructed around
the reserve pit until it is backfilled. Prior to backfilling the reserve pit, all fluids will be pumped
from thepit into trucks and hauled, to approved disposal sites. When the reserve pits are
backfilled, the surplus oil and mud, etc., will be buried a minimum of 3 feet below the surface of
the soil.

A closed system will be used during production. This means thatproduction fluids will be
contained in leak-proof tanks. All production fluids will be disposed of at approved disposal
sites.

Surface pipelines will be constructed to lay on the soil surface. The pipeline portion of the ROW
will not be bladed or cleared of vegetation without authorization of the BIA. Surface pipelines
shall be welded in place at well sites or on access roads. They shall be pulled into place and
assembled with suitable equipment. Vehicles shall not use pipeline ROWs as access roads unless
specifically authorized.

Buried pipelines shall be buried a minimum of 3 feet below the soil surface. After construction
is completed the disturbed area shall be contoured to blend into the natural landscape and be
reseeded between September 15 and November 1 of the year following construction with
perennial vegetation seed mixture provided by the BIA or Ute Tribe.

Before the site is abandoned, EOG will be required to restore the well site and ROWs to near
their original state. The disturbed areas will be reseeded with desirable perennial vegetation.

Soil erosion will be mitigated, by reseeding all disturbed
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DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDINGINFORMATION

Name of Company: EOG RESOURCES INC

Well Name: STAGECOACH U 81-18

Api No: 43-047-35492 Lease Type: INDIAN

Section 18 Township 09S Range 22E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor PETE MARTIN RIG # BUCKET

SPUDDED:
Date 08/05/04

Time 8:00 PM

How DRY

Drilling will commence:

Reported by DALL COOK

Telephone# 1-435-828-3630

Date 08/06/2004 Signed
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Form 3160-5 D STATES FORMAPPROVED(August 1999)
EPARTMENTOF THEINTERIOR OMBNO. 100M135

BUREAUOF LANDMANAGEMENT Expires:Novernbar30,2000
5. Lease SerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTSON WELLS BLA14-20-462447
Do not use this form for proposals to driff or to re-enter an

.6. I In o be Name

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse sicie. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/orNo,

1. Type of Well 8. WellNameand No.

O Dil Well B Gas Well O other STAGECOACHUNfT8t-18

2. Name of Operator Contact: ALFREDASCHULZ 9. API WeilNo.
EOG RESOURCES, INC E-Mail:atireda_schuiz@eogresourcescom 43-047-35492

3a. Address 3b, PhoneNo.(include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Explomtory
P. O. BOX 250 Ph: 307.276.4833 NATURALBUTTES
BIG PINEY,WY 83113

4. Locationof Well (Footqge, Sec., T., R., M., or SurveyDescription) I L Countyor Parish, and State

See 18 T9S R22E NENE 272FNL 228FEL UINTAHCOUNTY,UT
40.04255 N Lat, 109.47345 W Lon

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize O Deepen O Pmduction (Start/Resume) O WaterShut-Offg Notice of Intent
0 Alter casing 0 Fmeture Treat 0 Reclamation O Well Integrity

O Subsequent Report O CasingRepair O New Construction O Recomplete O Other
O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug andAbandon 0 Temporarily Abandon

0 convertto Injection 0 Plug Back g Water Disposal
13. Describe Proposedor CompletedOperation(clearlystate all pertinent details, includingestimated starting dateof anyproposed work and approximate durationthereof.If the proposal is to deependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measuredand true vertical depthsof all pertinentmarkers and zones.Attach the Bondunder which the work will be performed or providethe BondNo. on filewith BLlWBIA. Required subseque¤treports shallbe filed within30 daysfollowingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation resultsin a multiplecompletionor recompletionin a new interval,a Farm 3160-4shallbe filed oncetesting has beencompleted. Final Abandonment Noticesshallbe filedonly afterall requirements,includingreclamation,havebeertcompleted,and the operatorhasdeterminedthat the site is ready for final inspection.)

EOGResources, Inc. requests authorization for disposal of produced water from the referenced wellto any ofthe followinglocations:
1. Natural Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD.
2. Ace Disposal.
3. EOG Resources, Inc. drillingoperations (ChapitaWells Unit, Natural Buttes Unit, Stagecoach

. N Industries. wpted by the RECElVED
Utah Division of

Olt,Gas andMinM AUS16 2004

FORRECORDONLY DN,OFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. Ihereby certifythat the foregoingis true and correct.
Electronic Submission #34286 vedfie by the BLMWell Information System

For EOG RESOURCES, INC, sent to the Vemal

Name(Printed/Typed) ALFREDASCHULZ Tide SR. REGUL.ATORYASSISTANT

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 08/09/2004
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgravd By Title Dale
Conditionsof appmval, ifany, are attached. Approvalof thisnoticedoes not warrantor
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable tide to thoserights in the subjectlease
which wouldentitle the applicent to conductoperationsthereon. Office
Title 18U.S.C.Section 1001and Title43 U.S.C.Section1212,makeit a crimefor anypersonknowinglyandwillfullyto make to any departmentor agencyof the UnitedStates any false, ficdtiousor fraudulentstatementsor representations as to any matterwithin itsjurisdicdon.

" OPERATOR4UBMITTED **OPERATOR-SUBMITTED" OPERATOR-SUBMITTED
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING S LEASEDEStGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

BIA14-20-462-447
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTE INDIANTRIBE
T UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:

Donotuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells, significantlydeepen existingwells beFowcunentbottom-hole depth, reenier plugged wells, or to UTU-63027A
drillhorizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO ORILLforrn for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STAGECOACH UNIT81-18

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4304735492
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT.

P.O. Box 250 m BIG PINEY 83113 (307) 276-3331 NATURALBUTTES
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: 272' FNL - 228' FEL cousiv: UlNTAH

OTR/QTR,$ECTION,TOWNSHIP.RANGE,MERIDIAN: NENE 18 9S 22E S svxre:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^c=2e O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTlCE OF INTENT
(Submitin Duplicale) ALTEACASING FRACTURE TREAT SPDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approxmatedateworkwillstart CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTFON TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVfOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

2 SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Orignal Fonn Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofworkcompleijon

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: DRILLING
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION OPERATIONS

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

No drillingactivities have occurred since 8/05/2004.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Alfreda Schulz

sleNAvune

TLEs 890tatory Assistant

(This space for Stata use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER

BIA14-20-462-447

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
T'ENDI ,A NTIEEORTRIEBENAME:

7. UNITat CA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notuse this form for proposals to drellnewwells, significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottor hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to UTU-63027A

drillhorizontaFIaterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLfonn for suchproposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STAGECOACHUNIT81-18
2. NAMEOF OPERATOFt 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4304735492
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBEft: 10, FlELD ANDPOOL, OR WlLDCAT:

P.O. BOX 250 BIG PINEY WY 83113 (307) 276-3331 NATURALBUTTES
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT$URFACE: 272' FNL -228' FEL 40ß4255 LAT109.47345 LON COUNTY: UINTAH

OTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENE 18 9S 22E STATE:
UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
ACIDiZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

"°ue=•> O ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SDMCK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximale date work will starl: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVfDUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGETUB1NG PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELl. NAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit OriginalForm Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHi.fT-OFF
Dale ofwork completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOFWELLSITE OTHER: DRILLING
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECQMPLETE- DIFFERENTFORMATION OPERATIONS

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS, Cleartyshow allpertinent details including dates, depths. volumes, etc.

No drillingactivityhas occurred since spud on 8/3/2004.

NAME(PI-RSEPP.lMT} Kaylene R. Gardner ,,, , Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE I dA tA * DATE 10/11/2004

is space for State use only}

RECEIVED
{&2000} (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DNOFOIL,GAS
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STATEOF UTAH FORM

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OfL, GAS ANDMINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

BIA14-20-462-447

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
6 FINDI ,

ONTTEERBTRIBENAME:

7 UNITorCA AGREEMENTNAME:
Do notuse thisfann for proposals todrillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwellsbebw comentbottomMe depth, reenierplugged walls ''° UTU--63027A

drill horizontal laterals. Use AÞPUCATION FOR PERMITTODRILLform for auch proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER STAGECOACH UNIT81-18

2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC 4304735492
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. PHONE NUMBER 10. FtELDANDPOOL,0R WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX250 m, BIG PINEY WY ,83113 (307) 276-3331 NATURALBUTTES
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: 272' FNL - 228' FEL 40.04255 LAT109.47345 LON coumv: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENE 18 9S 22E sTArs:
UfAH

u. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O NOTICE OF JNTENT
ActDizE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT O SIDETRACKTOREPAIR WELL

Appmximate date workwillstart CASINGREPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELLNAME PLUGBACK WATER DISPOSAL
{Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCilON (START/RESUME) WATERSHUTOFF
Date ofworkcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECtAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER DRILLING
O COMT WELLTWE RECOMPLETE - DIEEEREWTFORMATON OPE RATIONS

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly showall pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

Please see the attached well chronology report for drillingoperations from 8/05/2004 - 11/12/2004.

1/gulatoryAssistant

RECEIVED
NOVf ?k

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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WELL CHRONOLOGY
eog resources REPORT
ese wwo, y swa Report Generated On: 11-12-2004

Well Name STAGECOACH81-18 Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA WELLS DEEP API # 43-047-35492 WellClass DRIL

County, State U1NTAH,UT Spud Date Class Date
Tax Credit N TVD / MD 10,715/10,715 Property # 053428
Water Depth 0 Last CSG 9.625 ShoeTVD / MD 2,427/2,427
KB / GL Elev 4,779/ 4,764

Location Section 18, T9S, R22E, NENE, 272 FNL & 228 FEL

Event No LO Description DRILL & COMPLETE
Operator EOG RESOURCES,INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 87.5

AFE No AFE Total DHC/ CWC
Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE#15 Start Date 10-13-2004 Release Date
10-10-2003 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling 30 Completion $0 Daily Total $0
Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total 50
MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: LOCATIONDATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

272'FNL & 228'FEL (NE/NE)
SECTION 18,TSS,R22E
UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH

OBJECTIVE: 10,715' TD, MESAVERDE

TRUE RIG#15

DW/GAS

STAGECOACHUNIT

CHAPITA WELLSDEEP

LEASE: BIA 14-20-462-447

ELEVATION4765' NATGL, 4764' PREP GL, 4779' KB (15')

EOG WI 100%,NRI 87.5%
10-13-2004 Reported By EDDIETROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 2,450 TVD 2,450 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :



- e OWellName:STAGECOACH81-18 Field:CHAPITAWELLSDEEP Property:053428

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUBILL JR'S BUCKETRIG.SPUDDED20" HOLE@8:00PM,8/5/04.

DRILLED 20" HOLETO45'. RAN45' OF 13 3/8" 54#H-40 CONDUCTOR PIPEANDCEMENTEDTO SURFACE.DRILLEDAND LINEDRATAND MOUSE HOLES. RD BUCKETRIG.

MIRUBILLJR'SAIR RIG.

DRILLED 12 U4"HOLE TO2,450'. HITA SMALLWATERFLOW AT775'. RUWIRELINE UNIT AND RUNDIRECTIONAL SURVEY,SURVEY 1DEGREE@2,180'. RAN $4 JTS (2,412.90') OF 9--5/8", 36.D#lFT,J-55, ST&CCASING& LANDED @2,427.40'KB. RUBiG 4 CEMENTERS. PRESSURETESTEDLINESAND CEMENTVALVETO 1500 PSIG. PUMP 170 BBLS WATER AHEAD. MIXED & PUMPED20 BBLSGELLEDWATERAHEAD OFCEMENT.

LEAD CEMENT:MIXED& PUMPED220 SX CLASSG CEMENTW/16%GEL& 10#/SXGILSONITE-3% SALT,2%CACL2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE, MIXEDCEMENT@11.0PPGW/YIELDOF 3.82 CF/SX(136.0 BBLS}.

TAIL CEMENT: MIXED & PUMPED200SX CLASS G CEMENT W/2%CACL2 & ¼ #/SX FLOCELE. MIXEDCEMENT@15.6 PPGW/YIELD OF I.18 CF/SX (42 BBLS). DISPLACEDCEMENTW/172.4 BBLSWATER,BUMPEDPLUG W/l.100#, CHECKEDFLOAT,FLOATHELD,SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE.HAD CEMENTRETURNSTOSURFACEBUTFELLBACK. RAN 1" PfPE DOWN ANNULUS.

TOP OUT #1: MIXED& PUMPED100SX PREMIUMCEMENT W/2% CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXEDCEMENT @16.0PPGW/YIELDOF 1,18CF/SX(21.00 BBLS). HAD4 BBLSCEMENTRETURNSTO SURFACE,CEMENTFELLBACK,

TOPOUT #2: MIXED & PUMPED 100SX PREMIUM CEMENT W/2%CACL2 & ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXEDCEMENT @16.0 PPG W/YIELDOF 1.18 CF/SX (21.00BBLS). HAD 4 BBLS CEMENTRETURNSTO SURFACE,CEMENT STAYED AT SURFACE.

RD BIG CEMENTERS. PREPAREDLOCATION FORROTARYRIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTILFURTHERACTIVITY

DALL COOKNOTIFIED ED FORSMAN W/BLM& CAROL DANIELSWlUOGMAT 4:45 PM ON 8/5/04OFSPUDDINGWELL.

8 CENTRALIZERS:ON 18T,2ND & 3RD COLLARSAND EVERYSTH COLLAR.

Page
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Fam 3160-5 UNITEDSTATES FORMMROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENTOF THEINTERIOR Exp 1, 007

BUREAUOFLAND MANAGEMENT 5.LeaseSeria1No
SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS "I^**2 "2-447

Do not use this form for proposals to dr/H or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,AlloneeorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (AÞD) for such proposals· UTE INDIAN TRIBE

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE-Other instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

STAGECOACH UNIT
1. Typeo 11

OilWell Q GasWell Q ¾ 8. WellNameandNa
STAGECOACH UNIT 81-18

1 Nameof r EOG RESOURCES, INC. 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo. (indude area code) 43-047-35492

P.O. BOX 250 Big Piney WY, 83113 307-276-3331 10.FieldandPool,orExploraloryArea
4. LocationofWell (Footage,Sec,T,R.,M, or Srney Description) NATURAL BUTTES

Section 18, T98, R22E, (NEINE)272 FNL 228 FEL 40.04255LAT 109.47345LON 11.CountyorParish, State

UINTAH COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPR1ATEBOX(ES)TOINDICATENATURE OF NGIICE, REPORT,OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidi2e Deepen Poduction (Sm/Remme) Wm Slmt-OE
ONotice ofIntent AberCasmg FmetureTreat Reclamadon WenIntegrhy

SubsequentRM Casing Repair NewConstruction Reœmplete Odier DRILLING

O ChangePlus PlqgandAbandon TempordrilyAbandon OPERATIONS
O FinalAbandomnentNotice Convertto lujection PlugBad WaterIX9posal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearlystateallpettmentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdateof anyproposedworkandapproximatedurationthereof.
If theproposalistodeependirectionallyorrecomplete horizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasuredandtrueverticaldepthsofallpertinentmarkersandzones.
AttachtheBondunderwhichtheworkwillbeperformedorprovidetheBondNo. on filewithBLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequentreportsshallbe filedwithin30 days
fonowingcompletionof theinvolvedoperations.Ifthe operationresultsina multiplecompletionorrecompletionina new interval,a Form3160-4shallbefiledonce
testinghasbeencompleted.FinalAbandonmentNoticesshallbe filedonlyafterallrequirements,meludingreclamation,havebeencompleted,andtheopemlorhas
determinedthatthesiteisreadyforfinalinspection.)

Please see the attached well chronology uport for drBling operations from 8/5/2004 -12/30/2004.

RECEIVED
JANU3 2005

DIVOF0]L,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing istrue and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Kayle e R. Gardner Title Regulatory Assistant

THISSPACE FOR FEDERALOR STAT OF ICE USE

Appvag
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

Title Date
Conditionsof approval,ifany,areattached.Appoval of thisnoticedoesnotwarrantor
certifythattheapplicantholdslegalor equitabletitletothoserights inthesubjectlease Office
whichwouldentitlethe applicantto conductoperationsthereon.
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001andTide43 US.C.Section1212,makeit a crimefor anypersonknowinglyand willfullytomaketo anydepartmentor agency ofthe United
Statesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsorrepresentations astoanymattetwithinitsjurisdiction.
(Instructionsonpage
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WELL CHRONOLOGY

Ueog resources REPORT

«.».yy ansamty som Report Generated On: 12-30-2004

Well Name STAGECOACH81-18 WellType DEVG Division DENVER

Fleid CHAPITAWELLSDEEP API # 43-047-35492 WeHClass DRIL

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 12-16-2004 Class Date

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 10,715/ 10,715 Property # 053428

Water Depth o Last CSG 9.625 Shoe TVD / MD 2,427/ 2,427

KB / GL Elev 4,779/ 4,764

Location Section 18,T9S, R22E,NENE,272 FNL & 228 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL &COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES,INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 87.5

AFE No 302493 AFE Total 1,521,100 DHC / CWC 855,700/665,400

Rig Contr . TRUE Rig Name TRUE #15 Start Date 10-13-2004 Releasè Date

10-10-2003 Reported By

DaHyCosts: Drilung $0 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total 50

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf: PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATIONDATA- - - -

Start End Hra Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATIONDATA

272' FNL & 228'FEL (NE/NE)

SECTION 18,T98, R22E
UINTAHCOUNTY UTAH

OBJECT1VE: 10,715' TD, MESAVERDE

TRUE RIG #l5

DWIGAS

STAGECOACHUNIT

CHAPITAWELLSDEEP

LEASE: BIA 14-20-462-447

ELEVATION 4765' NATGL, 4764' PREP GL, 4779' KB (15')

EOG WI 100%, NRI 87.5%

10-13-2004 Reported By EDDIE TRUTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,450 TVD 2,450 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKRDepth :



WellName: STAGECOACH81-18 Field:CHAPITAWELLSDEEP Property:053428

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRUBILLJR'S BUCKETRIG. SPUDDED20"HOLE @8:00 PM, 8/5/04.

DRILLED 20" HOLETO 45'. RAN 45' OF 13 3/8" 54# H-40 CONDUCTT)RPIPEAND CEMENTEDTO SURFACE.
DRILLEDAND LINED RATAND MOUSEHOLES. RD BUCKETRIG.

MIRUBILL JR'S AJRRIG.

DRILLED 12 1/4"HOLETO 2,450'. HIT A SMALLWATERFLOWAT 775', RU WIRELINE UNITAND RUN
DIRECTIONALSURVEY,SURVEYl DEGREE@2,180'. RAN 54 JTS (2,412.90') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#lFT,1-55, ST&C
CASING& LANDED@2,427.40'KB. RU BlG 4 CEMENTERS. PRESSURETESTED LINESAND CEMENTVALVE
TO 1500 PSIG. PUMP f70BBLS WATERAHEAD. MIXED & PUMPED20 BBLS GELLEDWATER AHEAD OF
CEMENT.

LEAD CEMENT:MlXED & PUMPED 220 SX CLASS G CEMENT W/16% OEL & 10#/SXGILSONITE-3% SALT,2%
ÇACL2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT @1LO PPG W/YIELDOF 3.82 CF/SX (136.0BBLS).

TAIL CEMENT' MIXED& PUMPED 200 SX CLASS G CEMENTWI2%CACL2& ¼ #/SX FLOCELE. MIXED
CEMENT@15.6PPG W/YIELDOF LIS CF/SX(42 BBLS). DISPLACEDCEMENTW/l72.4BBLS WATER,
BUMPED PLUGW/1,100#, CHECKEDFLOAT,FLOAT HELD, SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE. HAD CEMENT
RETURNSTO SURFACEBUT FELL BACK. RAN 1"PIPE DOWNANNULUS.

TOPOUT #l: MIXED& PUMPED 100 SX PREMlUM CEMENTW/2% CACL2& ¼#/SXFLOCELE. MIXED
CEMENT @ f6.0 PPG W/YIELDOF 1.18CF/SX (21.00 BBLS). HAD4 BBLSCEMENT RETURNSTO SURFACE,
CEMENTFELL BACK.

TOP OUT#2: MlXED & PUMPED 100SX PREMIUMCEMENT W/2% CACL2& ¼#/SX FLOCELE. MIXED
CEMENT@16.0PPG WlYIELDOF l.18 CF/SX (21.00 BBLS). HAD 4 BBLSCEMENT RETURNSTO SURFACE,
CEMENTSTAYEDATSURFACK

RD BIG CEMENTERS. PREPARED LOCATIONFORROTARYRIG, WORT. WILLDROP FROM REPORT UNTIL
FURTHERACTIVITY.

DALLCOOK NOTIFIED ED FORSMANW/BLM& CAROLDANlELSW/UOOMAT4:45 PM ON 8/5/04 OF
SPUDDINGWELL.

8 CENTRALIZERS: ON IST, 2ND & 3RD COLLARSAND EVERYSTH COLLAR.

12--15-2004 Reported By T. STONE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling ! Completion Well Total

MD 2,450 TVD 2,450 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0
Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: RUFLOOR,

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 17:30 i L5 MOVED RIG FROM CWU 647-1 TO STAGECOACH81-18. FINISHEDRIG REPAIRS TORAISE DERRICK.

RAISED DERRICKAT 15:30 HRS. RU RIG. ON RIG MOVE REPAIREDOR REPLACED: HYDRAMATIC,RUTARY
CLUTCHAND COUNTERSHAFT, HIGH DRUM CLUTCH,AND SPIDER, ESTIMATEDTOTAL RIG MOVE RU
TIME AT40 HR, ALL OTHER TIME SPENT ON RIG REPAIR. RIG ON DAYWORKAT 15:00 HRS, 12/14/04.
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Well Name: STAGECOACH81-18 Field: CHAPITAWELLS DEEP Property:053428

17:30 01:30 8.0 RU B&C QUICKTEST. TESTEDCASINGTO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MIN. TESTEDPIPE & BLINDRAMS,CHOKE &
KILL LINE & VALVES,CHOKE MANIFOLD. RU KELLY & INSTALLEDNEW KELLYSPINNER. TESTEDUPPER
& LOWERKELLYVALVE,FLOORVALVEAND INSIDEBOPTO 250/5000PSI. RD TESTER.

01:30 06:00 4.5 RU FLOOR. INSTALLED GAS BUSTER DISCHARGE,RU ROTARYDRIVECHAIN.

R1GON DAYWORKAT 15:00HRS, 12/14/04.

NOTIFIEDKIRK FLEETWOODWIVERNALBLM,SPUDNØilCE 09:00 HRS, 12/11/04
NOTIFIED CAROLDANIELSWIDEPTNATRES, SPUD NGTICE,0900 HRS, 12/11/04

12-162004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DaDyCosts: DriHing Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Compledon Well Total

MD 2,460 TVD 2,460 Prognse 10 Days i MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf: PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: SPOTGELL PILL FOR LUT

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:00 2.0 CHANGEDOUT BOITOM SECTIONOF STANDPIPE & STAND PIPE VALVE.
08:00 13:00 5.0 RUWIRELINE. CHOKE PANEL,PIPE SPINNERS. SET WEARBUSHING.
13:00 14:30 1 5 RACK, STRAP & CALIPER BHA. TESTED SURFACEEQUIPMENT.

14:30 15:00 0.5 SERVICED RIG.
15:00 16:30 L5 PU BHA.
16:30 17:30 1,0 LEVEL DERRICK.
17:30 20:00 2.5 PU BHA.

20:00 _ _21;00 1.0 RACKANDSTRAP DRILL PIPE.
21:00 01:00 4.0 SINGLE IN HOLE WIDP.

01;00 01:45 0.75 RACKAND STRAP DRILLPIPE.
01:45 02:15 0.5 SINGLE IN HOLE W/DP.

02:15 04:30 2.25 DRILL CEMENT/FLOATEQUIPMENT.
04:30 04:45 0.25 DRILLED2450'-2460'.
04:45 06:00 1.25 CIRCULATED HOLECLEAN. SPOTGEL PILL ON BTM.

SAFETY MEETING: PU BHA/PUDP
MTR#1 HUNTING7/8, 3 STG, .16 RPM/GAL
DAILYMTRHRS.25, CUM MTR HRS.25
TEMP 30 DEGREES

06:00 18.0 SPUD 7 7/8" SURFACE HOLEAT 4:30 HRS, 12/16/04
12-17-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total
MD 3,960 TVD 3,960 Progress 1,500 Days 2 MW 8.5 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0
Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:15 0.25 RUN LOT, 300 PSl W/8.4 PPG MUD, 10.7PPG EMW.
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WellName: STAGECOACH81,-18 Field:CHAPITAWELLS DEEP Property:053428

06:15 07:45 1.5 DRILLED2460'- 257T, RPM60+65, 15-20K WOB.

07:45 08:15 0.5 ClRCULATED. $URVEYEDAT2498', .75 DEG.

08:15 I I:00 2.75 DRILLED2577 - 2793', RPM60+45, l$-20K WOB.

11:00 11:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTED PIPE RAMS.

11:30 11:45 0.25 LEVELEDDERRICK.

11:45 16:00 4.25 DRILLED2793'-310T, RPM 60¥65, 18-20K WOB.

16:00 16:30 0.5 CIRCULATED. SURVEYED AT3027, 1 DEG.

16:30 19:4$ 3.25 DRILLED310T -3390', RPM 60 + 65, 18-20K WOB.

19:45 20:15 0.5 LEVELED DERRICK.

20:15 23:30 3.25 DRILLED3390'- 3610', RPM60 + 65, 18-20K WOB.

23:30 00:15 0.75 SURVEYEDAT3530', 2 DËG.

00:lS 06:00 5.75 DRILLED3610'-3960', RPM60 + 65, 18-20K WOB.

SAFETYMEETING: HARNESSES/RACKINGDRILL PIPE/CHEMICALS

BOP DRILLS

DAILY MTR HRS 20.75,CUM HRS 21 .

TEMP 31 DEGREES
DRILLINGWIPITSCLOSED IN

12-18-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts: Drilling Compledon Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WeUTotal

MD 5,325 TVD 5,324 Prognsa 1,365 Days 3 MW 8.9 Visc 28.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DR1LLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 08:15 2.25 DRILLED3960'-4113', RPM 60 + 65, 18-20K WOB.

08:15 09:00 0.75 CIRC. SURVEY AT 4032', 2 DEG.

09:00 11:15 2.25 DRILLED4113'-4270', RPM 60 + 65, 15-20K WOB.
11:15 11:45 0.5 SERVICED RIG, CHECKED CROWN-O-MATIC.

I1:45 16:15 4,5 DRILLED 4270' - 4614', RPM 60 + 65, 15-20K WOB,
16:15 17:00 0.75 CIRC, SURVEY AT4533', 2.25 DEG.
17:00 01:30 8.5 DRILLED4614'-5115', RPM 60 +65, 20-24K WOB.

01:30 02:15 0.75 CIRC, SURVEY AT5036', 3 DEG.
02:15 06:00 3.75 DRILLED5115'- 5325', RPM 60 + 65. 18-22K WOB.

SAFETY MEETING: HANDLING SLIPS/NEW HANDS/WIRELINESURVEYS
TEMP 29 DEO
MTR HRS DAILY21.25,CUM 42.25
BGG 3000--60000, CG 0-3000U, MAX GAS-7868

LITHOLOGY70% SH, 30% SS
12-1¾2004 Reported By KENMELDER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: DriHing i Completion WeH Totai
MD 6,143 TVD 6,141 Prognss 818 Days 4 MW 9.3 Visc 33.0
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WellName: STAGECOACH81-18 F3eld:CHAPITAWELLS DEEP Property;0$3428

Formation : . PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:00 7.0 DRILLED5325' - 5645', RPM 60 + 65, 20-25K WOB.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICED RIG. FUNCTIONTESTEDBOP.

13:30 13:45 0.25 SURVEYAT5563', 2 DEG.

13:45 06:00 16,25 DRILLED5645'-6143', RPM 60 + 65, 23KWOB.

SAFETYMEETING: SLIPPERYWALKWAYS/HANDSIGNALS/WIRELINESURVEYS

TEMP24 DEG

MTR HRS DAlLY23.25, CUM 65.5

BGG 2000-30000, CG 800-5000U, MAX GAS 8850U

LITHOLOGY 70% SH, 30% SS

12-20-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts: Drilung Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: DrilHag Completion WeHTotal

MD 6.860 TVD 6,857 Progress 717 Days 5 MW 9.6 Vise 32.0

Formadon : PBTD : 0.0 Perf: PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:30 0.5 SURVEYAT6064', 1 DEG.

06:30 13:30 7.0 DRILLED 6143'- 6389', RPM 60 + 65, 20-25K WOB.

13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTED BOP.

14:00 18:45 4.75 DRILLED 6389'- 6544', RPM 60 + 65, 23K WOB.

18:45 19:15 0.5 INSTALLED RUTHEADRUBBER.

19:15 22:45 3.5 DRILLED6544'- 6696', RPM 60 + 65, 23K WOB.

22:45 23:30 0.75 SURVEYAT6564', 1DEG.

23:30 06:00 6.5 DRILLED6696' - 6860', RPM 60 + 65, 23-25K WOB.

SAFETY MEETING: TONGS/MIXINGCAUSTIC/LOCKOUT-TAG OUT
MTR HRS DAILY21.75,CUM 87.25

BGG 1500-2400U, CO 400-2400U, MAX GAS 8564U

LITHOLOGY60% SH,40% SS

TEMP 23 DEG

12-21-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WeHTotal

MD 7,538 TVD 7.535 Progress 678 Days 6 MW 9.6 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 DRILLED 6860'- 6945', RPM 60 + 65, 20-25K WOB.

09:00 10:00 1,0 RECLAMP ROTARYHEAD.
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WellName: STAGECOACH81-18 Field: CHAPITAWELLSDEEP Property: 053428

10:00 13:00 3.0 DRILLED6945'- 7040', RPM 60 + 65, 20-25K WOB.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCITONTESTEDPIPE RAMS.

13:30 17:45 4.25 DRILLED7040'-7195', RPM 60 + 65, 20-25K WOB.

17:45 18:30 0.75 SURVEYAT7115', 2 DEG.

18:30 23:00 4.5 DRILLED7195'-7340, RPM 60 + 65, 20--25KWOB.

23:00 23:30 0.5 LEVELEDDERRICK.

23:30 06:00 6.5 DRILLED7340' - 7538', RPM 60 + 65, 20 - 25K WOB.

SAFETY MEETING: ROTATINGHEAD/CLEANINGWISTEAM/FALLINGOBJECTS

MTR HRS DAILY21.25,CUM 108.5

TEMP 32 DEG

BGG 600-2000U, CG 0-400U, MAX GAS 8434UAT7183'

LITHOLOGY60% SH, 35% SS, 5% LS

12-22-2004 Reported By KENMELDER

Dailycosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 7,914 TVD 7,911 Progms 376 Days 7 MW 9.6 Visc 33.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0,0

Activity at Report Time: LD MUD MUTOR

Start End Hra Acdvity Descripdon
06:00 11:00 5.0 DRILLED7538' - 7694', RPM 6¾ 65, 20-25K WOB.

11:00 11:30 0:5 SURVEYEDAT7612', 2 DEG.

I 1:30 12:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG. FUNCTIONTESTED PIPE RAMS,

12:00 19:00 7.0 DRlLLED 7694'-7914', RPM 50 + 65, 20 -25K WOB. RAlSED MW TO 10.0PPG.

19:00 21:00 2.0 CIRCULATEDFOR TOH. PUMPED PILL.

21:00 00:30 3.5 LD 88 JTS DRILLPIPE.

00:30 06:00 5.5 TOH, LD IBS'S, MUD MUTOR,DOG SUB &.BIT NO PROBLEMSON TOH.

SAFETYMEETING: BAND SIGNALS/LD DP/TRIPPING

MTR HRS DAILY12,CUM 120.5

TEMP22

BGG 300-1250U, CG 0-200U, MAX GAS 7680U

LITHOLOGY80% SS, 15%SH, 5% LS

12-23-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts: Drilung Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: DrBHug Compledon Well Total

MD 8,058 TVD 8,055 Prognies 144 Days 8 MW 9.8 Visc 31.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hra Activity Description

06:00 . 07:00 1.0 ENTER PIPE TALLY ON PASON.
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WellName: STAGECOACH81-18 Field: CHAPITAWELLS DEEP Property:053428

07:00 09:15 2.25 PU BIT,BS & DC. RIHWIBHA.

09:15 13:15 4.0 PU 91 JTS DRILLPIPE.

13:15 13:45 0.5 TlH.

13:45 14:45 1.0 EQUIPMENT REPA1R,WORKED ON HYDROMATIC.

14:45 18:00 3.25 TIH.

18:00 19:00 1.0 WASH/REAM100'TOBOTTOM.

19:00 06:00 11.0 DRILLED 7914'-8058', 68 RPM, 20-23K WOB.

SAFETY MEETING: PU DP/PlPE SPINNERS/WORKINGW/STEAM

TEMP 20 DEGREES

BGG 500-11009, CG 0-700U, MAX GAS 8043U

LITHOLOGY 60%SS,40% SH

12-24-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts:Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 8,133 TVD 8,130 Progress 75 Days 9 MW 10.3 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf: PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TlH

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 13:45 7.75 DRILLED 8058'-8133', 68 RPM, 25-30K WOB.

13:45 15:15 1.5 CIRCULATED FORTOH PUMPED PILL.

15:15 15:30 - -0.25 -DROPPEDSURVEYAT 8080', 1.75DEG.

15:30 22:00 6.5 TRIP OUT FOR BIT #3.

22:00 22:30 0.5 FUNCTIONTESTED BLINDRAMS. X/O BITS.

22:30 00:30 2.0 TRIP IN W/BHA.

00:30 01:30 1.0 WORKED ON BLOCKSLOCK.

01:30 03:00 LS TRIP IN 20 STDS. FILL PIPE, BREAK CIRC.

03:00 04:00 1.0 WORKED ON BLOCKSLOCK.

04:00 06:00 2.0 TRIP IN HOLE 30 STDS, BREAK CIRC.

SAFETY MEETING: FORKLIFT/PROPER LIFTINGTECHNIQUES/TRIPPING

TEMP 5 DEGREES

12-25-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 8,663 TVD 8,630 Progress 530 Days 10 MW 10.3 Vise 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORKON FLOWLINE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:45 2.75 TIB,

08:45 10:00 1.25 WASHIREAM75' TO BUTTOM.

10:00 13:30 3.5 DRILLED 8133'- 8225', 60 RPM, 20-23 K WOB.
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We11Name:STAGECOACH81-18 Field: CHAPITAWELLSDEEP Property:053428

13:30 14:00 0.5 SERVICEDRIG.

14:00 05:45 15.75 DRILLED8225'- 8663 , 60 RPM,23-27K WOB. RA1SEMWTO 10.6PPG.

05:45 06:00 0.25 WORKON FLOWLINE.

SAFETYMEETING: WORKINGIN COLD/SCRUBBINGIMOVINGMACHINERY

TEMP 9 DEGREES

BGG 1300-2000U,CG 0-700U, TG 4376U, MAX GAS 6684U

LTHOLOGY60%SS,40% SH

-26-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Com Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,274 TVD 9,271 Progms 611 Days 11 MW 10-5 Visc 36.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:15 0.25 WORKED ON FLOWLINE,

06:15 13:00 6.75 DRlLLED 8663' - 8882', 60 RPM, 23-25K WOB.

13:00 13:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG.

13:30 19:00 5.5 DRILLED 8882'-9074', 60 RPM, 23-25K WOB,

19:00 19:30 0.5 CHANGED SWAB& LINER#2 PUMP.

19:30 06:00 10.5 DRILLED 9074'-9274', 60 RPM, 20-28K WOB. 15-20'FLARE. RAISE MW TO 11.1 PPG. 10-15'FLARE.

SAFETY MEETING: ICY CONDITIONS/MIXINGMUD/BOPDRILL

TEMP 13 DEGREES

BGG 1300-7200U,CG>22000, MAX GAS 7806U

LITHOLOGY60% SH,40% SS

12-27-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts: DriHing Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,326 TVD 9,322 Progress 52 Days 12 MW I f.2 Visc 39.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: CUT DRLG LINE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 11:45 5.75 DRILLED 9274'-9326', 65 RPM, 20-29K WOB. RAISE MW TO ] l.3 PPG. 5-10' FLARE. LOST 125 BBLS MUD
TO SEEPAGE. PUMP LCM SWEEP. NO LOSSES AFTER SWEEP.

I1:45 19:00 7.25 CIRCULATEDFOR TOH. BYPASSSHAKER, MIX 5 PPB LCM. RAISEMW TO 11 5 PPG, STILL HAD 5-10'
FLARE. RAISE MW TO 1L7 PPG WINO FLARE.

I9:00 20:00 1.0 MIXED & PUMPEDPILL. DROPPED SURVEYAT 9300', 1,75DEG.

20:00 02:30 6.5 TRIP OUT FORBIT #4. FUNCTIONTESTED BLIND RAMS.

02:30 05:15 2.75 MU BlT #4 (RERUN#2). TRlP IN TO SHOE.

05:15 06:00 0.75 SLIP & CUT DRILL LINE.
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WellName: STAGECOACH81-18 Field:CHAPITAWELLSDEEP Property 053428

SAFETYMEETING: PlPE HANDLING/KICKSWHILETRIPPING/CUTTINGLINE

TEMP23 DEGREES

BGG 1500-18000, CG O-200U,MAX GAS 2330

LITHOLOGY 60% SH,40% SS

12-28-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 9,430 TVD 9,426 Pognsa 104 Days 13 MW 11.5 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 09:00 3.0 SL1P & CUT DRILL LINE.

09:00 09:30 0.5 FILL PIPE. CIRC. HELD SAPETY MEETING.

09:30 11:30 2.0 SLIP MORE DRLGLINE ON DRUM.

11:30 13:30 2.0 TRIP IN HOLE TO 6000'.

13:30 14:30 1.0 FILL PIPE. CfRC OUTGAS.

14:30 16:45 2.25 TlH.

16:45 17:15 0,5 WASHlREAM9219'-9252'.

17 15 18:00 0.75 CIRCULATEOUTTRIP GAS, 30-40' FLARE

18:00 19:30 1.5 WASH/REAM9252'-9326'.

19:30 03:45 8.25 DRILLED 9326'-9406, 69 RPM, 25-30K WOB,

03:45 04:45 _1.0 REAM_TIGHT HOLE9346'-9406'.

04:45 06:00 1.25 DRILLED 9406'- 9430', 69 RPM, 25-28K WOB.

SAFETY,MEETING:TRIPPING/REAMING/WORK[NGAROUND KELLY

TEMP 30 DEGREES

BGG 300-7000, CG 0-300U, TG 715IU

LITHOLOGY 65% SS, 35% SH

12-29-2004 Reported By KEN MELDER

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: DrilHug Conspietion Well Total

MD 9,700 TVD 9,696 Progress 270 Days 14 MW 11 8 Visc 40.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.Ð Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Acdvity at Report Time: DRILLINGAHEADAT9700'

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 23:15 17.25 DRILLED 9430'- 9623', 68 RPM, 20-30K WOB.

23:15 23:45 0.5 CLEANED SUCTIONSCREENON PUMP,

23:45 06:00 6.25 DRlLLED 9623'- 9700', 68 RPM, 20-25K WOB.

SAFETY MEETING: DRIVINGTO WORK/GOOD WORK RELATIONS

TEMP 30 DEG
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WellName: STAGECOACH81-18 Field:CHAPITAWELLSDEEP Property:053428

BGG300-1200U, CG O-300U, MAX GAS 3934U

12-30-2004 Reported By TOMSTONE

DailyCosts: Drliing Completion DaDyTotal

Cum Costs: Drluing Completion Well Total

MD 9,933 TVD 9,933 Progress 233 Days 15 MW 12.0 Vise 40,0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf: PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hra Activity Description
06:00 07:00 1.0 DRILLED 9700'-9706', WOB 25/30, RPM 60.
07:00 07:30 0.5 SERVICEDRIG.

07:30 06:00 22.5 DRILLED 9706'-9933', ROP 10.1FPH, WOB20/30, RPM 50/80.
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rum3145 UNITEDSTATES Folus RD

DEPARTMENTOFTilt IÑTElflOR $$ 31 7
BUREAUOFLANDMANAGEMENT i LeasessialNa

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS BIA luwwe

Do not use this forat for propoesta to drui or to re-enter an á If I AnoucewTribeName

0 15 ....w...a .... u.. s.... asso-a <avo>r., .... v.s.- UTE INDIANTRIBE

SUBMtTINTRIPLICATE-Other instructions onteversealde. 7. ironitorcAtAgreement,NameandwN

STAGECOACH UNIT
th

Well GasWell Other 8. WellNamearslNa
STAGECOACH UN1T 81•18

2.Named EOGRESOURCEG,INC. 9. APlWelINo,
3a Address 3b PhoneNo.thidukavard) 43-047-35492

P.O. BOX 250BigPiney WY, 83113 307-276-3331 10 Fieldanápool,or ExplorakryAma

4. LocationofWell (Footge,Sec..L R. Maky Ag NATURALSUTTES

Seenen is, T95, R22£, (NEINE) 272 FNL 228PEL 4044255 LAT 109.47345 LON

DINTAll COUNTY,UT

11 CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATUREOFNGHŒ, REPORT,OROTHERDATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOFACTION

Oma= O n... - (sma....> Owww-orr
O Numf Ment Mr Ung Bu lme Twat Rc&amak O Wei Igg

SubsequentR Cang Re¢r NewCosinodo Ron e a DRRUNG

O a....m.. O m....ut.o. O T.u-o am o-nous
On-u6 *- ** OconverteimonOmmas Owmoispo.s
11 D:scribe ProposederCompletedOpcration(clearlystaleallpartinentdetails,meludingestimatedsoutingdeleefanyproposedwelkandappioximatedurationIbereof

if theproposalistodeependirectionallyorrecompletehorixxilally,givesubsurfacelomtiamandmeaswedandtruevertical depihsofanpertinentmarimsandrones.
Attack theBomiunderwhichIhemerk willbep:rfonnederprovidetheBondNo. enfilewithBLlWBIARequimdsubsequerateportsshallbe10edwithin 30days
followingcompletionoftheinvolvedoperationlf theapmationresullsina multiplecompletionet recompletion inanewmterval,a Fenn3144 shallbefiledonce
testinghasbeen äniëfetäiCFiñafK6eiidðoiiiëimiseañali biffdedorüÿiiiWiWaileijiëlitimingssta, imtmarreempiuttad Wogralor has
delerminedthetthesiteisteadyforthialinspection.)

Pleasesee the attached won chronologyteportfor driDing operadens from 12/2ti/2004-014/2005.

14. Ihorvbvcertifythattheforegoingistrucandcoreet
Name (Prhrted/Typag

Kaylene IL Cardaer Title Regulatory Assistant

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STAT O FÅE USE

Appawedty Tide Dale
Canditionsof approval, ifally,are attached Approvalofthisnoticcdoesnotwanant er
certify thattheapplicant holdsicgalorequilaWeudetoihaserightainthesubject lease egy¡g,
whichwould estilletheopplicanttoconductoperminnstheleon
Title18USC. Seelim1001andTile43US C.Seèlion1212,inde its einio foranypersonknowinglyandwillfullyt snakelo anydepartmentoragencyofthe Udted
Statesanyfalse,fictidonsorfraudulentstatementsor representationsa toanymalterwithinitsjurisdiciion.
(lastructionsan page 2)







O O
rern3160-5 UNITEDSTATES FORMAPPIt0VED
(April2004) DEPARTMENTOFTHE INTERIOR W1

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS *'^14·2***

Do not use tiris form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,AllotteeorTribeName

abandoned weH. Use Form 3100-3 (APD) for sucir propoSSIS• UTE INDIAN TRIBE

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE-Other instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnitor CA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

STAGECOACH UNIT
1. Typeof

IWell GasWell r 8. WellNameandNa

1 Nameof
STAGECOACH UNIT 81-18

EOG RESOURCES, INC.

3a Address 3b. PhoneNo.(include area code) 43-047-35492

P.O. BOX 250 Big Piney WY, 83113 307-276-3331 10.FieldandPool,or ExploratoryArea

4. LocationofWell (Footage,Sec, 7, R.,M, or Steveymyg NATURAL BUTTES

Section 18, T95, R22E, (NE/NE) 272 FNL 128 FEL 40.04255 LAT 109.47345 LON

UINTAH COUNTY, UT

11 CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NCTIICE,REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidi2e Deepen Pmdudon (Start/Resume) Waer Shut-Off

ONotice of Intent AlterCaing FractureTreat Reclamation WellIntegrily

O casmsnepair O xewconsaucuonO Recomplete Oher DRILLING

O ChangePlus PlugandA TemporarilyAbandon OPERATIONS

O FinalAbandonmentNotice ConverttoInjecdon PlugBack WaterDisposal

13. DescribeProposedorCompletedOperation(clearlystateallpertinentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdateof anyproposedworkandapproximatedurationthereof
If the proposalistodeependirectionallyor recompletehorizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasuredandtrueverticaldepthsof allpertinentmarkersandzones.
Attach1heBondunderwhichtheworkwillbeperformedor providetheBondNo.on filewithBLM/BIA.Requimdsubsequentreportsshallbe filedwithin30days
followingcompletionoftheinvolvedoperations.If theoperationresultsina multiplecompletionor recompletionina newinterval,a Form3160-4shallbefiledonce
testiiighasbeencomplelixlFinafAbandonmëntNöticessTiillNTifëdcrly¯alterallrequatinenti, licTudingtectattatic11, have1mencompteled,andtheoperatorhas
determinedthatthesiteisreadyforfinalinspection)

TD reached 1/4/2005. Completion operations are scheduled tobegin en or about 2/15/2005.

14. Ihereby certify thatthe foregoingis true andcorrect
Name (Printed/Typed)

Kayten; R. Gardner Title Regulatory Assistant

Signature L Date 02/11/2005

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE OFFICEÑ8E

Approvedty Tide Date
Conditionsof approval,ifany,are attactied.Approvalof thisnoticedoesnot warrant or
certifythatthe applicantholdslegalor equitabletideto thoserights in thesubjectlease Office
whichwouldentitlethe applicanttoconductoperationsthereon,
Title 18U.S.C.Seelion1001and Tide43US.C.Seelian1212,makeit a enme foranypersonknowinglyandwillfrillyt or agency of the United
Statesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsorrepresentationsas toanymatterwtthinits jurisdiction. -

(Instructionsonpage 2) FEB15 2005
DIV.0F OIL,GAS&





O O
Fam 3160-5 UNITEDSTATES âg(April2004) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR ExpiresMaith31,2007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5 LeasesmalNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS niA14-zo-as2-447

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If indian,AllotteeorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160- 3 (APD) for such proposals UTE INDIAN TRIBE

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Ofher instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

1. Type o
ilWell GasWell C Other 8.

AGECOACH UNYT

STAGECOACH UNIT 81-18
EOG RESOURCES, INC. 9. APIWellNo.

3a Addoss 3b. PhoneNo. (includearea cde 43-047-35492

P.O. BOX 250 Big Piney WY, 83113 307-276-3331 10 FieldandPool,orExploratoryArea

4. LocationofWell (Foorqge,Sec, T, R, M, or SreveyDescrge) NA TURAL BUTI'ES

Section 18,T95, R22E, (NE/NE)272 FNL 228 FEL 40.04255 LAT 109.47345 LON lL CountyorParish, State

UINTAH COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize Dopen Production(Start/Resume) WalerShut-Off
ONotice of Intent AherCasing FractureTreat Reclamadon WellInt y

SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplew Other DRILLING

canagerians PlugandAbmdon TemporarilyAbandon OPERATIONS
FinalAbandonmentN Conven injecdon PlugBak WaterDisposal

13. DescribeProposedorCompleledOperation(clearlystateallpertinentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdateof anyproposedworkandapproximatedurationthereof
If theproposalistodeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasmedandtrueverticaldeptleof allpertinentmarkersand2cnes.
AttachtheBondunderwhich thework willbeperformedor providetheBondNo. onfdewithBLMlBIA.Requiredsubsequentreportsshallbe filedwithin 30days
followingcompletionofthe involvedoperations.Ifthe operationresults ina multiplecompletionorrecompletionina newinterval,a Forn 3160-4shallbefiledonce
testinghustwicañ¢ëtm Fifiã1AtmoninenTNöticesshaltbeTilddalÿ ãiteridtlequimne11ts¯lITeltidirigteclamatter ha fator has
determinedthatthe siteisready forfinalinspection.)

TD reached 1/4/2005. Compleffon operations are scheduled to begin on or about 3/2/2005.

RECEiVED
MARO12005

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MlNING

14. Iherebycertifythattheforegoingistrueandcorrect
Name (Printed/Typed)

Kaylene R. Gardner Title Regulatory Assistant

Signature i me 02/25/2005

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Appvdt
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

Title Date
Conditionsof approval,ifany, are attached,Approvalof thisnoticedoesnot warrant or
certifythat the applicantholdslegalor equitabletitleto thoserightsin thesubjectlease Office
whichwouldentitlethe applicantto conductoperationsthereon.
Title 18US.C Section1001andTitle43 US.C.Section1212,makeit a cdme foranypersonknowinglyand willfullytomaketo any departnientor agency of the United
Statesanyfalse,fictitiousorfraudulentstatementsorrepresentations as to anymatterwithin itsjurisdiction.
(Instructionsonpage





O O
Fon 31 5 UNITEDSTATES FORMAPPROVED

DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR 1,2007
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSaislNo

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS BIA 14-20-462-447

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 Iffndian,AffotteeorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such prop0SBÔ& UTEINDIANTRIBE

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on inverse síde. 7 IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo

STAGECOACH UNIT
1. Type of

ilWe]I O GasWell Ohr 8 WellNameandNa

1 Nameof
STAGECOACII UNIT 81-18

EOG RESOURCES, INC 9 APIWellNo.
3a Address 3b. PhoneNo.(includearea code) 43-047-35492

P. O. BOX 250, BIG PINEY, WY 307-276-3331 10.FieldandPool,or ExploratoryArea

4 LocationofWell (Foorqge,Sec,7, R, R or SaveyDeserpion) NATURAL BUTTES

272 FNL - 228 FWL, NE/NE, SECTION 18, T9S, R22E 11. Countyor Parish, State

UINTAH COUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NGIICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidi2e . Deepen Produeden (Stat/Resume) Waer Siwt-Off
Noticeof Intent Altr Cming FractureTreat Reclamation Weßin ty

SubsequentRy Cumg Repair NewConstruction Recomplek Okr

O ChangePlans PlugandAbandon TemporarilyAb ndo
O FinalAbandomnentNonce Conet toInjecdon PlugBack WaterD*sd

13. DescribeProposedorCompletedOperation(clearlystateallpertinentdetails,meludingestimatedstartingdateofanyproposedworkandapproximatedumtionthereof
If theproposalistodeependirectionallyorrecompletehorizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasuredandtruevertical depthsof allpertinentmarkersandzones.
AttachtheBondunder whichtheworkwillbeperformedor providetheBondNo. onfilewithBLM/BIA.Requiredsubsequentreportsshallbe fied within30days
followingcontpletionofthe involvedoperations.If theoperationresults ina multiplecompletionor recompletionina newinterval,a Form3160-4shallbefiledonce
testin¡(liasbeerfäõiñplercKTintxbatidetmrentNortos sbaltteTied oldylglWall requiremems,ircitidingleclamatiughaveteencompleled;and1heoperatorhas
determinedthatthesiteisreadyforfmalinspection.)

INITIAL PRODUCTION: The referenced well was turnedto sales at 10:00 a.m., 3/11/2005through Questarmeter # 6655 on a 10/64" choke.
Opening pressure, CP 4000 psig.

EOG RESOURCES, INC, operates under Nationwide Bond #2308.

14. I hereby certify thatthe foregoingistrue and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Signature

CE FOR FEDERALO

8R y t

03n4/2005

Approvedby Title Date
Conditionsof approval,ifany,are attached.Approvalofthisnoticedoesnot warrantor
certifythattheapplicantholdslegalor equitabletitleto thoserightsin the subjectlease Office
whichwould entitle theapplicanttoconductoperationsthereon.
Tide 18U.S.C.Section1()01and Title43U.SC.Section1212,make it a enme forany personknowinglyandwillfully tomaketo o of the United
Statesanyfalse,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsorrepresentations as toanymatterwithinits jurisdiction.
(Instructionson page 2)

DNOFOIL,GAS&





WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 03-18-2005

Well Name STAGECOACH81-18 WeBType DEVO Division DENVER

Field CHAPITAWELLSDEEP API # 43-047-35492 Well Class ISA

County, State UINTAH,UT Spud Date 12-16-2004 Class Date 03-11-2005

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 10,715/10,715 Property # 053428

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 4.5 Shoe TVD / MD 10,702/10,702

KB / GL Elev 4,779/ 4,764

Location Sotion 18,T98, R22E, NENE, 272 FNL & 228 FEL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL& COMPLETE

Operator EOGRESOURCES,INC WI% 100.0 NRI% 87.5

AFE No 302493 AFE Total DHC / CWC

Rig Contr TRUE Rig Name TRUE#15 Start Date 10-13-2004 Release Date 01-06-2005

1 10-2003 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total 50

Com Costs: DrlBing 50 Completion $0 Well Total 50

MD 0 TVD 0 Progstss 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0,0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATIONDATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

272' FNL & 228'FEL (NE/NE)

SECTION 18, T98. R22E

UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH

OBJECTIVE: 10,715' TD, MESAVERDE

TRUERIG #15

DW/GAS

STAGECOACH UNIT

CHAPITA WELLSDEEP

LEASE: BIA 14-20-462-447

ELEVATION4765' NATGL, 4764' PREP GL, 4779' KB (15')

EOG WI 100%, NRI 87.5%

10-13-2004 Reported By EDDIE TROTTER

I¾ailyCosts:Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 2,450 TVD 2,450 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth :



WellName: STAGECOACH81-18 Field: CHAPITAWELLSDEEP Property:053428

Cum Costs: DrilHug Completion Well Total

MD 10,715 TVD 10,715 Progress 0 Days 23 MW 12.4 Vise 45.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WOCOMPLETION

Start End Hra Aedvity Description

06:00 07:00 1.0 CEMENTED. DISPLACEDCEMENT W/166BBL WATER TREAREDW/L64. BUMPEDPLUG Wl3850PSIG.
RELEASEDPRESSURE,FLOATSHELD. CEMENT IN PLACEAT 06:30 HRS, RD BJ. LANDEDHANGER WISOK.
SHOESET AT 10,702', MARKERJOINTSAT7815' & 4590'.

07:00 13:00 6.0 ATTEMVTEDTO PRESSURETEST HANGER, WITHOUTSUCCESS. DETERMINEDHANGER LANDEDIN
CORRECTPOSITION. INJECTEDPACKINGMATERIAL1NTOVOIDWl6500PSI, TESTED FOR 15 MIN.

13:00 17:00 4.0 FINISHED CLEANINGMUD TANKS. CHANGED OIL IN FLOORMOTORS. SLIP& CUT DRILL LINE.

SAFETYMEETING: COMMUNICATING/RUNNINGCASINGILDPIPE

RIG RELEASEDTO CWU 893-27

17:00 . 7.0 RELEASEDRIG AT 1700 HRS, 1/6/05

CASING POINT COST $926,594
03-09-2005 Reported By SEARLE

DaDyCosts:Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drinfag Completion Well Total

MD 10,715 TVD 10,715 Progress 0 Days 24 MW 12.4 Vise 45.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 0.0 Perf : 9009-10603 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRACMESAVERDE

Start End Hra Activity Description

07:00 06:00 23.0 2/8/2005 - RAN RST/GR/CCUVDUCBL FROMPBTD TO 1000'. CEMENTTOP @2440'.

3/7/2005 - NU 10MFRACTREE. TEST CASINGTO 8500 PSIG.

3/8/2005 - MIRUCUTTERSWIRELINE & SCHLUMBERGER. PERFORATEBLACKHAWK@10,426'-27,
10,442'-43', 10,465'-6T, 10,484'-87', 10,528'-30', 10,540'-41', 10,56T-68', 10,588'-89' & 10,602'-03'@ 2 SPF @
180DEG. FRACDOWNCASINGWITH 4960 GALYFl25ST PAD, 45,387 GALYFl25ST &YF118STWITH 170,484#
20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8112 PSIG. MTR 50.2 BPM. ATP 6531 PSIG. ATR46.4 BPM. ISIP4450 PSIG.

SET 10KCOMPOSITEFRAC PLUG@9708". PERFORATELPR @9437-39', 9463'-64', 9499'-9500', 9561'-63',
9601'-03'& 9639'-42'@ 2 SPP @180DEG. FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH 4950 GALYF125ST PAD,49,522 GAL
YFJ25ST & YF1JESTWITH 193,729#20/40 SAND@1-6 PPG. MTP 8395 PSIG. MTR 49.8 BPM, ATP$795 PSIG.
ATR47.1 BPM. ISIP 3400 PSIG.

SET 10K COMPOSITE FRA PLUG @9410'. PERFORATE MPR@9193'-95', 9221*-22', 9236'-38', 9282'-85',
9319'-20', 9326'-27 & 9373'-75'@ 2 SPF @180 DEG. FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH4947 GALYF125ST PAD,
49,313 GALYF125ST& YF118ST WITH 192,563#20/40 SAND @14 PPG. MTP 8261 PSIG. MTR 50.4BPM. ATP
5780 PSIG. ATR 47.1 BPM. ISIP 3400 PSIG,

SET 10KCOMPOSITEFRAC PLUG @9170'. PERFORATEMPR @9009'-11', 9056'-59', 9078'-79', 908T-88',
9097-99', 9117'-18' & 9142'-44' @2 SPF @180DEG. FRACDOWNCASINGWITH 4954 GAL YF125STPAD,
48,737 GALYF125ST&YF1188T WITH 189,696#20/40 SAND @1-6 PPG. MTP 8456 PSIG. MTR 52.8 BPM. ATP
6534 PSIG. ATR 49 BPM. ISIP 6500 PSIG. RSWL & SCHLUMBERGER.

Page



WellName: STAGECOACH81-18 Field:CHAPITAWELLSDEEP Property:053428

FLOW 11HRS ON 12/64"CHOKE. FCP 3200 PSIG. EST45-50 BPH, RECOVERED 570 BLW. 5134 BLWTR.

03-10-2005 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,715 TVD 10,715 Progress 0 Days 25 MW 12.4 Vise 45.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 0.0 . Perf : 9009-10603 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW24 HRS ON 12/64"CHOKE. FCP 3500 PSIO.EST 15-20 BPH WILIGHTSAND. RECOVERED1080BLW.

4126 BLWTR.

03-11-2005 Reported By SEARLE

DailyCosts: Drilling Compledon Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,715 TVD 10,715 Progress 0 Days 26 MW 12.4 Visc 45.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 0.0 Perf : 9009-10603 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOWTEST - WO FACILITIES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOW24 HRS ON 12/64"CHOKE. FCP 3700 PSIG. EST 3-5 BPH. LIGHT CONDENSATE.RECOVERED265 BLW
3861 BLWTR. SW1@ 6:00AM. TURN WELLOVERTO PRODUCTIONDEPARTMENT.WO FACILITIES. DROP
FROMREPORTUNTIL FURTHERACTIVITY

FINAL COMPLETIONDATE 3/lûl05

03-12-2005 Reported By JAYORR

DailyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,715 TVD 10,715 Progress 0 Days 27 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 0.0 Perf : 9009-10603 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: INITlALPRODUCTION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 INITIAL PRODUCTION. OPENING PRESSURE: CP 4000 PSIG. TURNEDWELL TO QUESTARSALESAT 10:00
BRS, 3/11/05. FLOWING953 MCFD RATEON 10/64"CHOKE.

03-14- 2005 Reported By JAYORR

DanyCosts: Drilling Completion Daily Total
Cum Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,715 TVD 10,715 Progress 0 Days 28 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 0.0 Perf : 9009-10603 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 3/13/05 - FLOWED 1166 MCF, 10BO & 100 BW IN 24 HRS, ON 10/64"CK, CP 4100 PSIG.

3/14/05 -FLOWED 1497 MCF, OBO & 200 BW 1N24 HRS, ON 10/64" CK, CP 4100 PSIG.
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WellName: STAGECOACH81-18 Field: CHAPITAWELLSDEEP Property: 053428

03-15-2005 Reported By JAYORR

DaByCosis: DrUling Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: DrHling Completion WeHTotal

MD 10,715 TVD 10,715 Progress 0 Days 29 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 0,0 Perf: 9009-10603 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24,0 FLOWED 1649 MCF,OBO & 256 BW IN 24 HRS,ON 10/64"CK, CP4000 PSIG.

03-16-2005 Reported By JAYORR

DaHyCosts:DriRing Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: DriRing Completion Wel Total

MD 10,715 TVD 10,715 Progress 0 Days 30 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD: 0.0 Perf: 900Fl0603 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hra Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 1585MCF, 0 BO & 180BW IN 24 HRS,ON 10/64" CK, CP 4000 PSIG.

03-17-2005 Reported By JAY ORR

DaByCosts: Drilling . Completion Daily Total

Cum Costs: Drilling Completion WeHTotal

MD 10,715 TVD 10,715 Prognss 0 Days 31 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 0.0 Perf : 9009-10603 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 1737 MCF, 40 BO & 140BW IN 24 HRS,ON 10/64"CK, CP 3900 PSIG.

03-18-2005 Reported By JAYORR

DanyCests: Drilling Completion Daily Total

Cam Costs: Drilling Completion Well Total

MD 10,715 TVD 10,715 Progress 0 Days 32 MW 0,0 Vise 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 0.0 Perf: 9009-10603 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 1870MCP,OBO & 140BW IN 24 HRS,ON 10/64"CK, CP 3800 PSIG.
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g g
28b.Production- IntervalC
DaleFast Ìest Hems Test Oil Gas War OilGravily GAI ProductionMenni
Produced Date Tested ProductiottBEL MCP BBL Omr.API Gravity

Choke Tbg.Prest Csi 24Hr Oil Gas Water Gas il WellStatus
Six EIWS PE la- Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

28c.Pieduction- IntervalD¯Dale Ks! Test Homs Test Oil Gas Waler OilGravily Gas ProductionMethod
Produced Date Tested Productina BEL MCF BBL Ort. API Grady

¯Ønke¯
Ibg Prm. Osg. 24Hr. Oil Gas Water GasOH WenStatus

Se FIm Pless. Rg BBL MCF BBL Ralio
SI

29. DispositionofGas(Sold,usedforfuel,vented,etc.,

SOLD

3Œ SummuyofPorousZones(hrlude Aquifers): 31. Formation(14|)Markers
Sfiowall importantzonesofporosityandcontentsthereof: Coredintervalsandall drill-stem
tests,includingdepthintervaltested,cushionosed,timetoolopen,flowingandshut-inpressures
andrecoveries.

Formadon Top Bottom Descriptions,Contents,etc. Nmne MeyDepth

MESAVERDE 9009 10603 WASATCH 5016
CHAPITA WELLS 5605
BUCK CANYON 6281
NORTH HORN 6909
ISLAND 7417
MESAVERDE BUGTOP 7841
MIDDLE PRICE RIVER 8547
LOWER PRICE RIVER 9386
SEGO 9776
CASTLEGATE 9974
BLACKHAWK 10341

32.Additionaltemarks (includepluggingprocedure).

SEE ATTACHED SHEET.

33. Indicatewhich itmeshavebeenattachedby placinga check in the appropriateboxes:

0 Electrical/MechanicalLogs(1 fullsetreq'd.) 0 ceologicReport ODSTReport ODiæctional Sunrey
O SundyNodceforpluggingandcementverincatio.O CoreAnalysis 00ther

34 I herebycertifythatthe foregoingandattachedinformationiscompleteandconectasdeterminedfromallavailablerecords(seeattachedinstructions)*

Name(pleure Kaylene R. Gardner Tide Regulatory Assistaat

S % r Date 04/11/2005

Tide 18U.S.C S 1001andTitle43 U.S.C Section1212,makeit a crimeforany personknowinglyandwinfuny to maketo any departmentor agencyd the United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsorrepresentationsas toany matterwithin itsjurisdiction.

(Form316(M,page



O O
ADDITIONAL REMARKS (CONTINUED):

TURNED TO SALES THROUGH QUESTAR METER #6655. Two 400 bbl tanks #80558V & 80559V
are on location.

32. ADDITIONAL REMARKS
Perforated the Blackhawk from 10,426-27', 10,442-43', 10,465-67', 10,484-87', 10,528-30', 10,540-41', 10,567-
68', 10,588-89' & 10,602-03' w/2 SPF.
Perforated the Lower Price River from9437-39', 9463-64', 9499-9500', 9561-63', 9601-03' & 9639-42' w/2 SPF.
Perforated the Middle Price River from 9193-95', 9221-22', 9236-38', 9282-85', 9319-20', 9326-2T & 9373-75'
w/2 SPF.
Perforated the Middle Price River from9009-ll', 9056-59', 9078-79', 9087-88', 9097-99', 9117-18' & 9142-44'
w/2
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eog resources EOG Resources, Inc.
600 Seventeenth Street
Suite 1100N
Denver CO 80202
(303) 572-9000
Fax: (303) 824-5400

June 9, 2005

Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West NorthTemple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City,84114-5801

RE: Stage Coach 81-18
TO9S-R22E-Sec. 18
Uintah County, Utah

Carol:

Enclosed herewith are the followinglogs and data associated with the subjectwell:

Stage Coach 81-18
Cement Bond Log Gamma Ray/CCL 02-08-05 (2)
RST Log Gamma Ray CCL02-08-05 (2)

Ifyou have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Very trulyyours,

R

Cristal Messenger
Exploration&Operations Secretary ja 1 3 2005
Denver Office

DN.0FOiL.GAS
Enc. 4
cc: Well File

energy opportunity





Apr-lO-2OOS05:53pm From-EOGRESOURCES +14357897833 T-224 P.007/OOTF-931

STATEOFUTAH
PWM D

DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator: EOG RESOURCES Operator Account Number. N 9550

Address: P.O. BOX 1815

dg VERNAL

statq UT zip 84078 Phone Number. (435) 781-9111

Well i

API Number Well Name 40 See Twp Rng County

43-047-35492 STAGECOACHUNIT 81-18 NENE 18 98 22E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number
EffectiveDate

C 14256 13702 à la

Comments: CHANGE TO PARTICIPAT1NGAREA

PER BLM EFFECTIVE 3/1/2005

Well 2
API Number Well Name QQ See Twp Rng County

43-047-35604 STAGECOACHUNIT 86-20 NENE 20 98 22E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number
EffectiveDate

C 14693 13702 /Â ÜÍµ

Comments: CHANGE TO PARTICIPATINGAREA y (/TV)OS
PER BLM EFFECTIVE 6/1/2005

'

Wet1API
Number Well Name 00 See Twp Rng County

Action Code Curtant Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number
Effective Date

Comments:

ACTIONCODES:
A - Estabilsh newentityfornew well (single well only)

Kaylene R. Ganiner

B - Add new well to existing entity(grouporunitwell) Na ' I

C · Re-assign wellfromone existing entityto another existingentity

D · Re-assign well from one existingentity to a newentity to

E - Other (Explainin 'comments' section) Rg latory Assistant 4/10/2006

Title
Data

RECElVED
APR11 2006

DIVOFOlL,GAS&



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office TAl PRION
P.O. Box 45155 IN gg|CA

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

November 9, 2005

EOG Resources, Inc.
Attn: Debbie Spears
600 Seventeenth Street
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: 3 Revision of the
Mesaverde/Mancos Formation PA
Stagecoach Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

The 3" Revision of the Mesaverde/Mancos Formation PA, Stagecoach Unit, UTU63027D, AFS No.
891006951D, is hereby approved effective as of March 1, 2005, pursuant to Section 11 of the
Stagecoach Unit Agreement, Uintah County, Utah.

The 3" Revision of the Mesaverde/Mancos Formation PA, results in the addition of 160.00 acres to
the participating area for a total of 800.00 acres and is based upon the completion of Unit Well No.
SCU 81-18, API No. 43-047-35492, located in the NE¼NE¼ of Section 18, Township 9 South,
Range 22 East, SLM&B, Unit Tract No. 58, Lease No. 14-20-462-447, as a well capable of
producing unitized substances in paying quantities.

Copies of the approved requests are being distributed to the appropriate Federal agencies and one
copy is returned herewith. Please advise all interested parties of the approval of the 3 Revision of
the Mesaverde/Mancos Formation PA, Stagecoach Unit and its effective date.

Sincerely,

Is/ David H. Murphy

David H. Murphy
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure RECEIVED
NOV17 2005

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Fann 31f65 UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED
(February 2005) DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR E 31 007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS BI^14·2 462 447

Do not use thIs form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, AllotteeorTribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposais• Ute Indian Tribe

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Otherinstructíons on reverse side. 7. IfUnitorCA/Agreement,Nameand/orNo.

l. Typeof
lWell GasWell COther 8. W Na d

2. Nameof Stagecoach Unit 81-18
EOG Resources, Inc. 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. Phone No.(include area code) 43-047-35492

600 17th Street, Suite 1000N, Denver, CO 80202 303-824-5526 10.Fieldand Pool,or ExploratoryArea

4. Locationof Well (Footage,Sec.,T, R.,M.,or SurvevDescription) Natural Buttes/Wasatch/Mesaverde

272' FNL & 228' FEL (NE/NE) I1. CountyorParish, State

Sec. 18-T9S-R22E 40.042550 LAT 109.473450 LON Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATENATURE OF NDITCE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

O Acidize Deepen Poduction (Start/Resume) Waw Shut-OŒ
Noticeof Intent AlterCasing FractureTreat Reclamadon WeßIndty

SubsequentReport Casing Repair NewConstruction Recomplete Other Pit reclamation

O ChangePhns Plugand Abandon TemporarilyAbandonO FinalAbandonment Notice ConvernoInjection PMBack WaterDisposal

13. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearly state all pertinentdetails,includingestimated starting dateof any proposedwork and approximate durationthereof.
If theproposalis todeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and truevertical depthsof all peltinentmarkem and zones.
Attach the Bond under which thework will beperformedor providethe Bond No. on filewith BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequent reports must be filedwithin 30days
followingcompletion of theinvolvedoperations. Iftheoperation results ina multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval,a Form316Œ4must be tiledonce
testing has beencompleted. Final Abandonment Notices must befiledonly after all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determinedthatthesite isready forfmalinspection.)

The reserve pit for the referenced location was closed on 5/19/2006as per the APD procedure.

14. l hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed)

Mary A. Maestas Title Regulatory Assistant

signati Date 01/09/2007

THis SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Dale
Conditionsof approval, ifany,are attached. Approval of thisnotice doesnot warrant or
certifythattheapplicant holdslegalor equitable titleto thoserights in thesubject lease Office
which would entitletheapplicant toconductoperations thereon.

Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Tide43 U.S.C.Section1212,makeit a crimefor any personknowinglyand willfully to make to any de t y United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to anymatter within itsjurisdiction. -

(Instructions on page 2)
JAN10 2007

S&
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