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PERilITC0

14421 County Rd. 10 • Ft. Lupton, Colorado 60621 • (303) 857-9999 • FAX(303) 857-0577 • E-MAILPermitco l@aoLcom

October31, 2003

DivisionofOil,Gas&Mining
1594West NorthTemple,Suite 1210
Box145801
SaltLakeCity,UT 84114-5801

Re: GASCOEnergy,Inc.lPannonianEnergy,Inc.
Federal#48-30-9-19
1980'FSLand659' FEL
NESE Section30, T9S-R19E RECEIVED
UintahCounty,Utah
UTU-37246 NOVO3 2003

Gentlemen: DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING

Enclosed pleasefindthreecopiesoftheApplicationfor Permitto Drill,alongwiththerequired
drillingprogram, BOPdiagram, wellsitemapsanddiagrams.

Ifyou shouldneed additionalinformation,please don't hesitate to contact me. Approved
copiesofthe A.P.D.shouldbe sent to PermitcoInc.at theaddress shownabove.

Sincerely,

PERMITC0INC.

LisaSmith
Consultant for
GASCOEnergy,Inc.lPannonianEnergy,Inc.

Enc,

cc: GascoEnergy,Inc.lPannonianEnergy,Inc. - Englewood,
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0 O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
AMENDED REPORTDIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING (highlight changes)

5. MINERAL LEASE NO.: 5. SURFACE:
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL UTu-37246 BLM

1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILL E REENTERO DEEPEN O 7. IF INDIAN.ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

N/A
B. TYPEOF WELL: OILO GASÐ OTHER SINGLEZONE|O MULTIPLEZONEO 8. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

N/A
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

GASCOEnergy,Inc./Pannonian Energy,Inc. Federal#43-30-9-19
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD ANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:

14 Inverness DriveEast, Suite#H236,Englewood,CO80112 303-483-0044 HŒiit 1.\ Á
4. LOCATION OF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR,SE NSHIP,RANGE

<¡ty 2 R i g ooDDD MERIDIAN:
ATSURFACE: 1980'FSLand659'FEL (pgI0 log FI 5 6 9 Sec.30,T9S-R19E

AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: NESE

14- DISTANCE IN MILESAND DIRECTIONFROM NEARESTTOWNOR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

Approximately25.3milesSoutheastofMyton,UT Uintah UTAH
15. DISTANCE TO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE (FEET) 16. NUMBER OF ACRES INLEASE: 17. NUMBER OF ACRESASSIGNED TOTHIS WELL:

659' 600 N/A
18. DISTANCE TO NEAREST WELL (DRILLING, COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:

APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET):

Approx.4000' 11,500' Bond#UT-1233
21. ELEVATIONS (SHOWWHETHER OF, RT. GR,ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATEDATE WORK WILL START: 23. ESTIMATED DURATION:

4810' GL 1/15/2004 30 Days

24. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHTPER FOOT SETTINGDEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, YIELD,AND SLURRY WElGHT

17-1/2" 13-3/8",H40,48# 225' 225sx PremiumType5, 15.6ppg,1.18yield
12-1/2" 9-5/8",J-55,40# 3500' 410sx Hi-Fill,11 ppg,3.83yld+ 200sx Class 'G',15.8ppg,1.16yld
7-7/8" 4-1/2",P110,13.5# 11,500' 650sx Lite,12.6ppg, 1.89yld+ 2250sx Poz, 13.6ppg,1.42yld

RECFIVFD
2s. ATTACHMENTS gy

VERIFYTHE FOLLOWING AREATTACHED INACCORDANCE WITH THEUTAH OIL AND GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL RULES:

WELL PLAT OR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSEDSURVEYOR OR ENGINEER COMPLETE DRILLINGPROGRAM
N. OF OIL, GAS&MINING

EVIDENCE OF DIVISIONOF WATER RIGHTSAPPROVAL FOR USE OF WATER FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHERTHAN THE LEASE OWNER

AGENT: PermitColiic. '
AGENTS PHONE NO.: 303-857-9999

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) LISa L.Smith TITLE AgGAtIOr GASCOEnergy,Inc] PannonianEnergy,Inc.

SIGNATURE (S DATE October31,2003
(This space for State use only)

API NUMBER ASSIGNED
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GASCO ENERGY, INC.T9S, Ri9E, S. L.B. &M Well location, FEDERAL #43-30-9-19, located
N89°57'E

- 79.94 (G.L.O.) as shown in the NE 1/4 SE 1/4 of Section 30,
T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. Uintoh County, Utah.

BASIS OF BEARlNGS BASIS OF ELEVATION
O

BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. 4 SPOT ELEVATiONLOCATED AT THE NORTHWEST CORNER
S OF SECT10N 31. T9S, R19E S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE
o CROW KNOLL,QUADRANGLE, UTAH, UiNTAH COUNTY, 7.5

MINUTE QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE
---- ---- UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTER10R,

GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID ELEVATIONLS MARKED AS
BEING 4838 FEET.

raio Brass em N
1.5' Mph, Paa30 ., st-

I
FEDERAL/4 J- JO-9-19

o Elev. Ungroded Ground = 4810' g 659'

SCALE
---- N CERTIFICATE

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MAOC•&ŸÄfÑAUNDER MY
SUPERVI5t0N AND THAT THE SAME R RDE A¾ t0RRE0T TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BE .••

R R
18 19 1910 Bass Cap, REGISTEREDLAND SURV(
E E 20' Myh, Pås REGISTRATÌðÑNO 6131

or stones SB9'46'47"E - 2636.25' (Meas.) ST4TE OF. UTAH
NB9°58'E

- 39.98 (G.LO.) N894J'48"W - 2634.94' (Meas.) carner s y/4Ýge . ¿V

(AUTOWOMOUSNAD 83) REVISED: 10-21-03
LA 7/TUDE = 4070'00.31" (40000086) UINTAH ENGINEERING & L AND SURVEYING

LONGI TUDE = 109°48'5& l5" (109.816153)
LEGEND: 85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAls UTAH 84078

(435) 789-1017
=

90° SYMBOL
SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

= PROPOSED WELL HEAD, 1" = 1000 3-12-03 3-14-03
PARTY REFERENCESA = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. K.K. A.P. C.G. G.L.O. PLAT

A = SECTION CORNERS RE-ESTABLlSHEO BY E th se WEATHER FILE
DOUBLE PROPORTION MKETHOD. (Not Set on Ground) erass cap COOL CASCO ENERGY,
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O O
CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE

ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1

ApprovalofOperations on Onshore
Federaland IndianOil&GasLeases

FEDERAL#43-30-9-19
1980'FSLand 659' FEL

NESE Section 30,T9S- R19E
UintahCounty,Utah

Prepared For:

GASCOEnergy,Inc./PannonianEnergy,Inc.

By:

PERMITC0INC.
14421CountyRoad 10

Ft. Lupton,Colorado80621
303/857-9999 RECEIVED

NOVO3 2003
Copies Sent To: DW.OF OIL GAS a y¡

3 - Bureau ofLand Management- Vernal,UT
- UtahDivisionofOil,Gas &Mining- SLC,UT /* **+

2 - GASCOEnergy, Inc.lPannonianEnergy,Inc. - Englewood,CO

PEILIITC0
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O O
APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER

24. Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Attached.

2. A Drilling Plan

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the SUPO shall be filed with the Appropriate Forest
Service Office.

See SurfaceUsePlanAttached.

4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see Item20).
Bond coverageforthis wellis providedbyGASCOEnergy,Inc./Pannonian Energy,Inc. undertheirBLMBondNo.Bond
#UT-1233.

5. Operator certification.
Please be advisedthat GASCOEnergy,Inc./PannonianEnergy,Inc. is consideredto be the operatoroftheabove
mentionedwell.GASCOEnergy,Inc./Pannonian Energy,Inc.agreesto be responsibleunderthetermsandconditions
ofthelease for the operationsconducteduponthe leased lands.

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the authorized
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ONSHOREOlL&GASORDERNO.1
ApprovalofOperationsonOnshore

FederalandIndianOilandGasLeases

Allleaseand/orunitoperationswillbeconductedinsuchamannerthatfullcomplianceismadewithapplicable
laws,regulations(43CFR3100),OnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,andtheapprovedplanofoperations.The
operatorisfullyresponsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbefurnished
thefieldrepresentativetoinsurecompliance.

1. ESTIMATEDTOPSOFIMPORTANTGEOLOGICMARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea

Uintah Surface +4,820'

GreenRiver 1,685' +3,135'

Wasatch 5,235' -415'

MesaVerde 8,995' -4,175'

LowerMesaVerde 10,635' -5,815'

Castlegate 11,275' -6,455'

T.D. 11,500' -6,680'

2. ESTIMATEDDEPTHOFANTICIPATEDWATER,OIL,GASORMINERALFORMATIONS:

Substance Formation Depth

Oil&Water GreenRiver '
1,685'

Gas Wasatch 5,235'

Gas Mesaverde 8,995'
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Allfreshwaterprospectivelyvaluablemineralsencounteredduringdrilling,willbe recorded
by depth andadequatelyprotected.Alloilandgas showswillbe testedto determine
commercialpotential.

3. PRESSURECONTROLEQUIPMENT

GASCOEnergy,Inc./PannonianEnergy,Inc.'sminimumspecificationsforpressurecontrolequipment
areas follows:

RamType: 11"Hydraulicdoublewithannular,5000psiw.p.

Ramtypepreventersandassociatedequipmentshallbe testedtoapprovedstackworkingpressure
if isolatedby testplugor to70 percent of internalyieldpressureofcasing. Pressure shallbe
maintainedforat least 10minutesoruntilrequirementsoftestaremet,whicheveris longer. Ifa test
plugis utilized,nobleed-offpressureisacceptable.Fora testnotutilizingatestplug,ifa declinein
pressureofmorethan10percentin30 minutesoccurs,thetestshallbe consideredtohavefailed.
Valveoncasinghead belowtestplugshallbe openduringtestofBOPstack.

Annulartypepreventers(ifused)shallbe testedto50 percentofratedworkingpressure.Pressure
shallbe maintainedat least 10minutesoruntilprovisionsoftestaremet,whicheveris longer.

Asa minimum,theabovetestshallbe performed:

a. wheninitiallyinstalled;
b. wheneveranysealsubjecttotestpressureis broken
c. followingrelatedrepairs;and
d. at 30-dayintervals

Valvesshallbe testedfromworkingpressuresideduringBOPEtestswithalldownstreamvalves
open.

Whentestingthekilllinevalve(s)thecheckvalveshallbe heldopenortheballremoved.

Annularpreventersshallbe functionallyoperatedat leastweekly.
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Pipeandblindramsshallbe activatedeachtrip,however,thisfunctionneednotbe performedmore
thanoncea day.

ABOPEpitleveldrillshallbeconductedweeklyforeachdrillingcrew.

Pressuretestsshallapplytoallrelatedwellcontrolequipment.

Alloftheabovedescribedtestsand/ordrillsshallbe recordedinthedrillinglog.

BOPsystemsshallbeconsistentwithAPIRP53. Pressuretestswillbe conductedbeforedrillingout
fromundercasingstringswhichhave been set andcementedinplace.Blowoutpreventercontrols
willbe installedpriortodrillingthesurfacecasingplugandwillremaininuseuntilthewelliscompleted
orabandoned.Preventerswillbe inspectedandoperatedat leastdailytoensuregoodmechanical
workingorder,andthisinspectionwillbe recordedon thedailydrillingreport.Preventerswillbe
pressure testedbeforedrillingcasingcementplugs.

TheDistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientleadtime,inordertohavetheBLMrepresentative
on locationduringpressuretesting.

a. ThesizeandratingoftheBOPstackisshownontheattacheddiagram.Althougha righas
notbeenchosentodrillthiswell,mostoftheequipmentforthisdepthofholeintheareause
a 11",5000psiworkingpressureblowoutpreventor.

b. Achokelineanda killlinearetobe properlyinstalled.The killlineis _not tobe usedas a
fill-upline.

c. Theaccumulatorsystemshallhavea pressurecapacitytoprovideforrepeatedoperationof
hydraulicpreventers.

d. Drillstringsafetyvalve(s),tofitalltoolsinthedrillstring,aretobe maintainedontherigfloor
whiledrillingoperationsareinprogress.

.
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4. PROPOSEDCASINGANDCEMENTINGPROGRAM:

a. The proposedcasingandcementingprogramshallbe conductedas approvedtoprotect
and/orisolateallusablewaterzones,potentiallyproductivezones,lostcirculationzones,
abnormallypressuredzones,andanyprospectivelyvaluabledeposits of minerals.Any
isolatingmediumotherthancementshallreceiveapprovalpriortouse.Thecasingsetting
depthshallbe calculatedtopositionthecasingseatoppositea competentformationwhich
willcontainthe maximumpressure to which it willbe exposedduringnormaldrilling
operations.Determinationofcasingsettingdepth shallbe basedonallrelevantfactors,
including;presencelabsence of hydrocarbons;fracture gradients;usablewaterzones;
formationpressures;lostcirculationzones;otherminerals;orotherunusualcharacteristics.
Allindicationsofusablewatershallbe reported.

b. Casingdesign shallassumeformationpressuregradientsof0.44 to0.50 psi perfootfor
exploratorywells(lackingbetterdata).

c. Casingdesignshallassumefracturegradientsfrom0.70to1.00psiperfootforexploratory
wells(lackingbetterdata)

d. Casingcollarsshallhavea minimumclearanceof0.422inchesofallsidesinthehole/casing
annulus,withrecognitionthatvariancescanbe grantedforjustifiedexceptions.

e. AIIwaitingoncementtimesshallbeadequatetoachieveaminimumof500psicompressive
strengthat thecasingshoepriortodrillingout.

f. Allcasingexcepttheconductorcasing,shallbe neworreconditionedandtestedusedcasing
thatmeetsorexceedsAPIstandardsfornewcasing.

g. Thesurfacecasingshallbe cementedbacktosurfaceeitherduringtheprimarycementjob
orby remedialcementing.

h. Allindicationsofusablewatershallbe reported'totheauthorizedofficerpriortorunningthe
nextstringofcasingorbeforepluggingordersarerequested,whicheveroccursfirst.

i. Threecentralizerswillbe runonthebottomthreejointsofsurfacecasingwitha minimumof
onecentralizerperjointstartingwiththeshoejoint.
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j. Topplugsshallbe usedtoreducecontaminationofcementbydisplacementfluid.Abottom
plugorotheracceptabletechnique,suchas a suitablepreflushfluid,innerstringcement
method,etc.shallbe utilizedtohelpisolatethecementfromcontaminationbythemudfluid
beingdisplacedaheadofthecementslurry.

k. Allcasingstringsbelowtheconductorshallbepressuretestedto0.22psiperfootofcasing
stringlengthor1500psi,whicheverisgreater,but nottoexceed70percentoftheminimum
internalyield,ifpressuredeclinesmorethan10percentin30minutes,correctiveactionshall
be taken.

I. Onallexploratorywells,andonthatportionofanywellapprovedfora 5MBOPEsystemor
greater,a pressureintegritytestofeachcasingshoeshallbe performed.Formationatthe
shoeshallbe testedtoa minimumofthemudweightequivalentanticipatedtocontrolthe
formationpressuretothenextcasingdepthorattotaldepthofthewell.Thistestshallbe
performedbeforedrillingmorethan20feet ofnewhole.

m. Theproposedcasingprogramwillbe asfollows:

Purpose Depth HoleSize 0.D. Weight Grade Type New/Used

Conductor 0-225' 17-1/2" 13-3/8" 48# H-40 - - - New

Surface 0-3500' 11" 8-5/8" 32# J-55 ST&C New

Production 0-11,500' 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 LT&C New

n. Casingdesignsubjectto revisionbased ongeologicconditionsencountered.
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shoeshallbe testedtoa minimumofthemudweightequivalentanticipatedtocontrolthe
formationpressuretothenextcasingdepthorattotaldepthofthewell.Thistestshallbe
performedbeforedrillingmorethan20feet ofnewhole.

m. Theproposedcasingprogramwillbe asfollows:

Purpose Depth HoleSize 0.D. Weight Grade Type New/Used

Conductor 0-225' 17-1/2" 13-3/8" 48# H-40 - - - New

Surface 0-3500' 11" 8-5/8" 32# J-55 ST&C New

Production 0-11,500' 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 LT&C New

n. Casingdesignsubjectto revisionbased ongeologicconditionsencountered.
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o. Thecementprogramwillbe asfollows:

Conductor TypeandAmount

0-225' 225sxPremiumType5 @15.6ppg,1.18yield
Cementwillbe circulatedtosurface

Surface TypeandAmount

0-3500' Lead:410sxHi-Fill@11ppg,3.83yield
Tail:200sxClass'G'@15.8ppg,1.16yield
Cementwillbe circulatedtosurface

Production TypeandAmount

2,500-11,500' Lead:650sxLite@12.6ppg,1.89yield
Tail:2250sx50:50Poz @13.6ppg, 1.42yield

p. Anticipatedcementtopswillbe reponedastodepth;nottheexpectednumberofsacksof
cementtobe used. The DistrictOfficeshouldbe notified,withsufficientlead time,inorder
tohavea BLMrepresentativeonlocationwhilerunningallcasingstringsandcementing.

q. Aftercementingbutbeforecommencinganytest,thecasingstringshallstandcementeduntil
thecementhas reacheda compressivestrengthofat least500psiattheshoe. WOCtime
shallbe recordedinthedriller'slog.

r. Thefollowingreportsshallbe filedwiththeDistrictManagerwithin30daysaftertheworkis
completed.

1. Progress reports,Form3160-5(formerly9-331)"SundryNoticesandReportson
Wells",mustincludecompleteinformationconcerning:

a. Settingofeachstringofcasing',showingthesize,grade,weightofcasing
set, holesize,settingdepth,amountsandtypeofcementused.whether
cementcirculatedor thetopofthecementbehindthecasing,depth of
cementingtoolsused, casingtestmethodandresults,and thedatework
wasdone. Showthespuddate onthefirstreportssubmitted.
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b. Temperatureorbondlogsmustbesubmittedforeachwellwherethecasing
cementwasnotcirculatedtothesurface.

s. Auxiliaryequipmenttobe usedisasfollows:

1. Kellycock

2. Nobitfloatis deemednecessary.

3. Asubwitha fullopeningvalve.

5. MUDPROGRAM

a. The proposedcirculatingmediumstobe employedindrillingareas follows:

Interval MudType MudWt. Visc. FIL PH

0-225' Water --- --- --- ---

225' - 3,500' NativeMud 8.5-9.0 - - - - - - - - -

3,500' - 11,500' FreshWater/DAP 9.0-11.5 40 15-20 7-8

Therewillbe sufficientmudon locationtocontrola blowoutshouldoneoccur.
Amudtestshallbe performedevery24hoursaftermuddinguptodetermine,as applicable:
density,viscosity,gelstrength,staticfiltrationloss,andPh.

b. Mudmonitoringequipmenttobe usedis as follows:

1. Periodiccheckswillbe madeeachtourofthemudsystem.The mudlevelwillbe
checkedvisually.

c. Nochromateadditiveswillbe usedinthemudsystemonFederaland/orIndianlandswithout
priorBLMapprovaltoensureadequateprotectionoffreshwateraquifers.
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d. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitleillinanamountequaltoorgreaterthan
10,000 poundswillbe used,produced,stored,transported,or disposedofannuallyin
associationwiththedrillingofthiswell.Furthermore,noextremelyhazardoussubstances,
as definedin40 CFR355, inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used,produced,stored,
transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.

e. The useofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformto43 CFR3610.2-3.

6. EVALUATIONPROGRAM

The anticipatedtypeandamountoftesting,loggingandcoringareasfollows:

a. Nodrillstemtestsareanticipated,however,ifDST'sarerun,thefollowingrequirementswill
beadheredto:

Initialopeningofdrillstemtesttoolsshallbe restrictedto daylighthours unlessspecific
approvaltostartduringotherhoursisobtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.However,DST's
maybe allowedtocontinueatnightifthetestwasinitiatedduringdaylighthoursandtherate
offlowis stabilizedand ifadequatelightingis available(i.e.lightingwhichis adequatefor
visibilityandvapor-proofforsafeoperations).Packerscanbe released,buttrippingshallnot
beginbeforedaylight,unlesspriorapprovalisobtainedfromtheauthorizedofficer.Closed
chamberDSTsmaybe accomplisheddayornight.

ADSTthatflowstothesurfacewithevidenceofhydrocarbonsshallbe eitherreversedout
ofthetestingstringundercontrolledsurfaceconditions.Thiswouldinvolveprovidedsome
meansforreversecirculation.
Separationequipmentrequiredfortheanticipatedrecoveryshallbe properlyinstalledbefore
a teststarts.

Allengineswithin100feetofthewellborethatarerequiredto"run"duringthetestshallhave
sparkarrestersorwatercooledexhausts. '

b. TheloggingprogramwillconsistofaGammaRayfromTD- Surface,andaSP/DIUFDC/CNL
fromTD - 3,500'.

c. NoCores areanticipated.
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d. Whetherthewellis completedas a dryhole or as a producer,"WellCompletionand
RecompletionReportandLog"(Form3160-4)willbe submittednotlaterthan30 daysafter
completionofthewelloraftercompletionofoperationsbeingperformed,inaccordancewith
43 CFR 3164. Twocopiesofalllogs,coredescriptions,coreanalyses,well-testdata,
geologicsummaries,sampledescription,andallothersurveysordataobtainedandcompiled
duringthedrilling,workover,and/orcompletionoperations,willbe filedwithform3160-4.
Samples(cutting,fluids,and/orgases0 willbe submittedwhenrequestedbytheauthorized
officer(AO).

e. The anticipatedcompletionprogramwillbe as follows:Perforatezonesofinterest,fracture
andstimulate,andplaceonproduction.

f. Dailydrillingandcompletionprogressreportsshallbe submittedtotheBLMinVernalona
weeklybasis.

7. ABNORMALTEMPERATURESORPRESSURES

a. Theexpectedbottomholepressureis 6877psi.

b. No hydrogensulfidegas is anticipatedandnoabnormalpressures or temperaturesare
anticipated.

8. ANTICIPATEDSTARTINGDATESANDNOTIFICATIONOFOPERATIONS

a. Drillingis plannedtocommenceonJanuary15,2004.

b. Itis anticipatedthatthedrillingofthiswellwilltakeapproximately30days.

c. The BLMin Vernal,Utahshallbe notifiedoftheanticipateddate of locationconstruction
commencementandofanticipatedspuddate.

'

d. Nolocationwillbeconstructedormoved,nowellwillbe plugged,andnodrillingorworkover
equipmentwillbe removedfroma welltobe placed in a suspendedstatuswithoutprior
approvalofthe AO. Ifoperationsare tobe suspended,priorapprovalofthe AOwillbe
obtainedandnotificationgivenbeforeresumptionofoperations.
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e. The spuddate willbe reportedorallyto theAOwithin48 hoursafterspudding.Ifthe
spuddingoccursonaweekendorholiday,thereportwillbesubmittedonthefollowingregular
workday. Theoralreportwillbefollowedupwitha SundryNotice.

f. InaccordancewithOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,thiswellwillbe reportedonForm3160-
6 "MonthlyReportofOperations",startingwiththemonthinwhichoperationscommenceand
continueeachmonthuntilthewellisphysicallypluggedandabandoned.Thisreportwillbe
filedwiththeVernalBLMDistrictOffice,170South500East,Vernal,UT 84078.

g. ImmediateReport:Spills,blowouts,fires,leaks,accidents,oranyotherunusualoccurrences
shallbe promptlyreportedinaccordancewiththerequirementsofNTL-3Aorits revision.

h. Ifa replacementrigiscontemplatedforcompletionoperations,a"SundryNotice"Form3160-
5 tothateffectwillbe filed,forpriorapprovaloftheAO,andallconditionsofthisapproved
planareapplicableduringalloperationsconductedwiththereplacementrig.

i. Shouldthewellbesuccessfullycompletedforproduction,theAOwillbe notifiedwhenthe
wellisplacedina producingstatus.Suchnotificationwillbe sentbytelegramorotherwritten
communications,notlater than5 days followingthedate onwhichthewellis placedon
production.

j. PursuanttoOnshoreOrderNo.7,withtheapprovaloftheDistrictEngineer,producedwater
maybe temporarilydisposedofintounlinedpitsfora periodofupto90 days. Duringthe
periodsoauthorized,anapplicationforapprovalofthepermanentdisposalmethod,along
withthe requiredwater analysisandotherinformation,mustbe submittedtotheDistrict
Engineer.

k. PursuanttoNTL-4A,lessees oroperatorsareauthorizedtovent/flaregas duringinitialwell
evaluationtests,notexceedinga periodof30 days ortheproductionof50 MMCFofgas,
whicheveroccursfirst. Anapplicationmustbe filedwiththeDistrictEngineerandapproval
received,foranyventing/flaringofgasbeyondthe initial30dayorauthorizedtestperiod.

l. Aschematicfacilitiesdiagramas requiredby43CFR3162.7-5(b.9.d.),shallbesubmittedto
the appropriateDistrictOfficewithinsixty(60) days of installationor first production,
whicheveroccursfirst.Allsitesecurityregulationsas specifiedinOnshoreOrderNo.3shall
be adheredto. Allproductlinesenteringandleavinghydrocarbonstoragetankswillbe
effectivelysealedinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.7-5(b.4.).
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e. The spuddate willbe reportedorallyto theAOwithin48 hoursafterspudding.Ifthe
spuddingoccursonaweekendorholiday,thereportwillbesubmittedonthefollowingregular
workday. Theoralreportwillbefollowedupwitha SundryNotice.

f. InaccordancewithOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,thiswellwillbe reportedonForm3160-
6 "MonthlyReportofOperations",startingwiththemonthinwhichoperationscommenceand
continueeachmonthuntilthewellisphysicallypluggedandabandoned.Thisreportwillbe
filedwiththeVernalBLMDistrictOffice,170South500East,Vernal,UT 84078.

g. ImmediateReport:Spills,blowouts,fires,leaks,accidents,oranyotherunusualoccurrences
shallbe promptlyreportedinaccordancewiththerequirementsofNTL-3Aorits revision.

h. Ifa replacementrigiscontemplatedforcompletionoperations,a"SundryNotice"Form3160-
5 tothateffectwillbe filed,forpriorapprovaloftheAO,andallconditionsofthisapproved
planareapplicableduringalloperationsconductedwiththereplacementrig.

i. Shouldthewellbesuccessfullycompletedforproduction,theAOwillbe notifiedwhenthe
wellisplacedina producingstatus.Suchnotificationwillbe sentbytelegramorotherwritten
communications,notlater than5 days followingthedate onwhichthewellis placedon
production.

j. PursuanttoOnshoreOrderNo.7,withtheapprovaloftheDistrictEngineer,producedwater
maybe temporarilydisposedofintounlinedpitsfora periodofupto90 days. Duringthe
periodsoauthorized,anapplicationforapprovalofthepermanentdisposalmethod,along
withthe requiredwater analysisandotherinformation,mustbe submittedtotheDistrict
Engineer.

k. PursuanttoNTL-4A,lessees oroperatorsareauthorizedtovent/flaregas duringinitialwell
evaluationtests,notexceedinga periodof30 days ortheproductionof50 MMCFofgas,
whicheveroccursfirst. Anapplicationmustbe filedwiththeDistrictEngineerandapproval
received,foranyventing/flaringofgasbeyondthe initial30dayorauthorizedtestperiod.

l. Aschematicfacilitiesdiagramas requiredby43CFR3162.7-5(b.9.d.),shallbesubmittedto
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whicheveroccursfirst.Allsitesecurityregulationsas specifiedinOnshoreOrderNo.3shall
be adheredto. Allproductlinesenteringandleavinghydrocarbonstoragetankswillbe
effectivelysealedinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.7-5(b.4.).

PEIL

ONSHOREORDERNO.1 CONFlDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GASCOEnergy,Inc.lPannonianEnergy,Inc.
Federal #43-30-9-19 Lease No.UTU-37246
1980'FSLand659'FEL
NESE Section30,T9S- R19E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 10

e. The spuddate willbe reportedorallyto theAOwithin48 hoursafterspudding.Ifthe
spuddingoccursonaweekendorholiday,thereportwillbesubmittedonthefollowingregular
workday. Theoralreportwillbefollowedupwitha SundryNotice.

f. InaccordancewithOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1,thiswellwillbe reportedonForm3160-
6 "MonthlyReportofOperations",startingwiththemonthinwhichoperationscommenceand
continueeachmonthuntilthewellisphysicallypluggedandabandoned.Thisreportwillbe
filedwiththeVernalBLMDistrictOffice,170South500East,Vernal,UT 84078.

g. ImmediateReport:Spills,blowouts,fires,leaks,accidents,oranyotherunusualoccurrences
shallbe promptlyreportedinaccordancewiththerequirementsofNTL-3Aorits revision.

h. Ifa replacementrigiscontemplatedforcompletionoperations,a"SundryNotice"Form3160-
5 tothateffectwillbe filed,forpriorapprovaloftheAO,andallconditionsofthisapproved
planareapplicableduringalloperationsconductedwiththereplacementrig.

i. Shouldthewellbesuccessfullycompletedforproduction,theAOwillbe notifiedwhenthe
wellisplacedina producingstatus.Suchnotificationwillbe sentbytelegramorotherwritten
communications,notlater than5 days followingthedate onwhichthewellis placedon
production.

j. PursuanttoOnshoreOrderNo.7,withtheapprovaloftheDistrictEngineer,producedwater
maybe temporarilydisposedofintounlinedpitsfora periodofupto90 days. Duringthe
periodsoauthorized,anapplicationforapprovalofthepermanentdisposalmethod,along
withthe requiredwater analysisandotherinformation,mustbe submittedtotheDistrict
Engineer.

k. PursuanttoNTL-4A,lessees oroperatorsareauthorizedtovent/flaregas duringinitialwell
evaluationtests,notexceedinga periodof30 days ortheproductionof50 MMCFofgas,
whicheveroccursfirst. Anapplicationmustbe filedwiththeDistrictEngineerandapproval
received,foranyventing/flaringofgasbeyondthe initial30dayorauthorizedtestperiod.

l. Aschematicfacilitiesdiagramas requiredby43CFR3162.7-5(b.9.d.),shallbesubmittedto
the appropriateDistrictOfficewithinsixty(60) days of installationor first production,
whicheveroccursfirst.Allsitesecurityregulationsas specifiedinOnshoreOrderNo.3shall
be adheredto. Allproductlinesenteringandleavinghydrocarbonstoragetankswillbe
effectivelysealedinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.7-5(b.4.).

PEIL



O O
ONSHOREORDERNO.1 CONFIDENTIAL- TlGHTHOLE
GASCOEnergy,Inc./PannonianEnergy,Inc.
Federal #43-30-9-19 Lease No.UTU-37246
1980'FSLand659'FEL
NESESection30,T9S- R19E DRILLINGPROGRAM
UintahCounty,Utah Page 11

m. A firstproductionconferencewillbe scheduledwithin15 daysafterreceiptofthefirst
productionnotice.

n. NowellabandonmentoperationswillbecommencedwithoutthepriorapprovaloftheAO.
Inthecaseofnewlydrilleddryholesorfailures,andinemergencysituations,oralapproval
willbe obtainedfromtheSO. A"SubsequentReportofAbandonment"Form3160-5,willbe
filedwiththeAOwithin30daysfollowingcompletionofthewellforabandonment.Thisreport
willindicatewhereplugswere placedandthecurrentstatusofsurfacerestoration.Final
abandonmentwillnot be approveduntilthe surfacereclamationworkrequiredby the
approvedAPDorapprovedabandonmentnoticehas been completedtothesatisfactionof
theAOorhis representative,ortheappropriateSurfaceManagingAgency.

o. PursuanttoOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.1, lesseesandoperatorshavetheresponsibility
to see thattheirexploration,development,production,and constructionoperationsare
conductedinamannerwhichconformswithapplicableFederallawsandregulationsandwith
Stateand local laws and regulationsto the extentthatsuchStateand local laws are
applicabletooperationsonFederalorIndianlands.

Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078

Phone: 435/781-4400 Fax: 435/781-4410
After Hours:

Ed Forsman Petroleum Engineer 435/828-7874

Kirk Fleetwood Petroleum Engineer 435/828-7875
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ONSHOREOIL&GASORDERNO.1
NOTIFICATIONREQUIREMENTS

LocationConstruction- forty-eight(48)hourspriortoconstructionoflocationandaccessroads.

LocationCompletion- priortomovingonthedrillingrig.

SpudNotice - at leasttwenty-four(24)hourspriortospuddingthewell.

CasingStringand - twenty-four(24)hourspriortorunningcasingand
Cementing cementingallcasingstrings.

BOPandRelated - twenty-four(24)hourspriorto initiatingpressuretests.
EquipmentTests

FirstProduction- withinfive(5)businessdays afternewwellbeginsor
Notice productionresumesafterwellhas been offproductionformorethan

ninety(90)days.

The onsiteinspectionforthesubjectwellsitewasconductedonMarch26, 2003atapproximately3:00
p.m. Weatherconditionswerecloudy,coolandwindy.Inattendanceattheonsiteinspectionwerethe
followingindividuals:

ByronTolman NaturalResourceSpecialistBureauofLandManagement
LisaSmith PermittingAgent Permitcoinc.
RobertKay LandSurveyor UintahEngineeringandLandSurveying

1. EXISTINGROADS

a. Theproposedwellsiteis locatedapproximately25.3milessoutheastofMyton,Utah.

b. DirectionstothelocationfromMyton,Utahareas follows:
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Proceedina southeasterlydirectionfromMyton,Utahforapproximately19.2miles.Turn
rightat theEightMileFlatareaandproceedsoutheasterlyfor4.6milestotheaccessinto
the#7-25Alocation.Continuesoutheasterlytowardthe#13-30Blocationfor0.5miles..
Beforereachingthelocation,turnleftandproceednortherly,theneasterlyfor1 mile.
Turnrightontothenewaccessrouteandproceedsoutherlyla distanceofapproximately
300feet tothelocation.

c. Forlocationofaccessroadswithina 2-Mileradius,seeMapsA&B.

d. Improvementtoexistingmainroadswillnotbe required.

e. Allexistingroadswillbemaintainedandkeptingoodrepairduringalldrillingand
completionoperationsassociatedwiththiswell.

f. Existingroadsandnewlyconstructedroadsonsurfaceunderthejurisdictionofany
SurfaceManagingAgencyshallbemaintainedinaccordancewiththestandardsofthe
SMA.

2. PLANNEDACCESSROADS

a. Themajorityoftheroadisanexistingupgradedoilfieldroad, their#7-30wellsite.

b. Themaximumgradeofthenewconstructionwillbe approximately3%.

c. Noturnoutsareplanned.

d. Nolowwatercrossingsorculvertswillbe necessary.

e. Thelast300feetofnewaccessroadwascenterlineflaggedatthetimeofstaking.

f. Theuseofsurfacingmaterialis notanticipated,,howeveritmaybenecessarydepending
onweatherconditions.

g. Nocattleguardswillbe necessary.

ONSHOREORDERNO.1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GASCOEnergy,Inc./PannonianEnergy,Inc.
Federal #43-30-9-19 Lease No.UTU-37246
1980'FSLand659'FEL
NESE Section30,T9S- Ri9E SURFACEUSEPLAN
UintahCounty,Utah Page 2

Proceedina southeasterlydirectionfromMyton,Utahforapproximately19.2miles.Turn
rightat theEightMileFlatareaandproceedsoutheasterlyfor4.6milestotheaccessinto
the#7-25Alocation.Continuesoutheasterlytowardthe#13-30Blocationfor0.5miles..
Beforereachingthelocation,turnleftandproceednortherly,theneasterlyfor1 mile.
Turnrightontothenewaccessrouteandproceedsoutherlyla distanceofapproximately
300feet tothelocation.

c. Forlocationofaccessroadswithina 2-Mileradius,seeMapsA&B.

d. Improvementtoexistingmainroadswillnotbe required.

e. Allexistingroadswillbemaintainedandkeptingoodrepairduringalldrillingand
completionoperationsassociatedwiththiswell.

f. Existingroadsandnewlyconstructedroadsonsurfaceunderthejurisdictionofany
SurfaceManagingAgencyshallbemaintainedinaccordancewiththestandardsofthe
SMA.

2. PLANNEDACCESSROADS

a. Themajorityoftheroadisanexistingupgradedoilfieldroad, their#7-30wellsite.

b. Themaximumgradeofthenewconstructionwillbe approximately3%.

c. Noturnoutsareplanned.

d. Nolowwatercrossingsorculvertswillbe necessary.

e. Thelast300feetofnewaccessroadwascenterlineflaggedatthetimeofstaking.

f. Theuseofsurfacingmaterialis notanticipated,,howeveritmaybenecessarydepending
onweatherconditions.

g. Nocattleguardswillbe necessary.

ONSHOREORDERNO.1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GASCOEnergy,Inc./PannonianEnergy,Inc.
Federal #43-30-9-19 Lease No.UTU-37246
1980'FSLand659'FEL
NESE Section30,T9S- Ri9E SURFACEUSEPLAN
UintahCounty,Utah Page 2

Proceedina southeasterlydirectionfromMyton,Utahforapproximately19.2miles.Turn
rightat theEightMileFlatareaandproceedsoutheasterlyfor4.6milestotheaccessinto
the#7-25Alocation.Continuesoutheasterlytowardthe#13-30Blocationfor0.5miles..
Beforereachingthelocation,turnleftandproceednortherly,theneasterlyfor1 mile.
Turnrightontothenewaccessrouteandproceedsoutherlyla distanceofapproximately
300feet tothelocation.

c. Forlocationofaccessroadswithina 2-Mileradius,seeMapsA&B.

d. Improvementtoexistingmainroadswillnotbe required.

e. Allexistingroadswillbemaintainedandkeptingoodrepairduringalldrillingand
completionoperationsassociatedwiththiswell.

f. Existingroadsandnewlyconstructedroadsonsurfaceunderthejurisdictionofany
SurfaceManagingAgencyshallbemaintainedinaccordancewiththestandardsofthe
SMA.

2. PLANNEDACCESSROADS

a. Themajorityoftheroadisanexistingupgradedoilfieldroad, their#7-30wellsite.

b. Themaximumgradeofthenewconstructionwillbe approximately3%.

c. Noturnoutsareplanned.

d. Nolowwatercrossingsorculvertswillbe necessary.

e. Thelast300feetofnewaccessroadwascenterlineflaggedatthetimeofstaking.

f. Theuseofsurfacingmaterialis notanticipated,,howeveritmaybenecessarydepending
onweatherconditions.

g. Nocattleguardswillbe necessary.



O O
ONSHOREORDERNO.1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GASCOEnergy,Inc./PannonianEnergy,Inc.
Federal #43-30-9-19 Lease No.UTU-37246
1980'FSLand659'FEL
NESE Section30,T9S- R19E SURFACEUSEPLAN
UintahCounty,Utah Page 3

h. Surfacedisturbanceandvehiculartravelwillbe limitedtotheapprovedlocationand
approvedaccessroute.Anyadditionalareaneededwillbe approvedinadvance,

i. Accessroadsandsurfacedisturbingactivitieswillconformtostandardsoutlinedinthe
BureauofLandManagementandForestServicepublication:SurfaceOperatinq
StandardsforOilandGasExplorationandDevelopment,(1989).

j. The roadwillbe constructedlupgradedtomeetthestandardsoftheanticipatedtrafficflow
andallweatherroadrequirements.Constructionlupgradingshallincludeditching,
draining,graveling,crowingandcappingtheroadbedas necessarytoprovidea well
constructedsaferoad.Priortoupgrading,theroadshallbe clearedofanysnowcover
andallowedtodrycompletely.Travelingoffthe30footright-of-waywillnotbe allowed.
Roaddrainagecrossingsshallbe ofthetypicaldrycreekdrainagecrossingtype.
Crossingsshallbe designedsotheywillnotcausesiltationoraccumulationofdebrisin
thedrainagecrossingnorshallthedrainagesbe blockedbytheroadbed.Erosionof
drainageditchesbyrunoffwatershallbe preventedbydivertingwateroffat frequent
intervalsbymeansofcutouts.Upgradingshallnotbe allowedduringmuddyconditions.
Shouldmudholesdevelop,theyshallbe filledinanddetoursaroundthemavoided.

k. NochemicalssubjecttoreportingunderSARATitlelilinanamountequaltoorgreater
than10,000poundswillbe used,produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofannually
inassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell.Furthermore,noextremelyhazardous
substances,asdefinedin40 CFR355,inthresholdplanningquantities,willbe used,
produced,stored,transported,ordisposedofinassociationwiththedrillingofthiswell,

l. Noroadrightofwaywillbe necessary.

3. LOCATIONOFEXISTINGWELLSWITHINA1-MILERADIUSOFTHEPROPOSEDLOCATION.
(See Map"C")

a. Waterwells- none

b. Injectionwells- none

c. Producingwells- five
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d. Drillingwells- none

e. Shut-inwells- none

f. Temporarilyabandonedwells- none

g. Disposalwells-none

h. Abandonedwells- none

i. DryHoles- three

4. LOCATIONOFTANKBATTERIESANDPRODUCTIONFACILITIES.

a. Allpermanentstructures(onsiteforsixmonthsorlonger)constructedorinstalled
(includingoilwellpumpjacks)willbe paintedCarlsbadCanyon.Allfacilitieswillbe
paintedwithinsixmonthsofinstallation.Facilitiesrequiredtocomplywiththe
OccupationalSafetyandHealthAct(OSHA)willbe excluded.

b. Ifstoragefacilities/tankbatteriesareconstructedonthislease, thefacility/batteryorthe
wellpad shallsurroundedbya containmentdikeofsufficientcapacitytocontainata
minimum,theentirecontentsofthelargesttankwithinthefacilitylbattery,unlessmore
stringentprotectiverequirementsaredeemednecessarybytheauthorizedofficer.

c. Forlocationofproposedproductionfacilities,see ProductionFacilityDiagramattached.

d. Allloadinglineswillbe placedinsidethebermsurroundingthetankbattery.

e. Gasmeterrunsforeachwellwillbe locatedwithin500feetofthewellhead.Thegasflow
linewillbe buriedoranchoreddownfromthewellheadtothemeterand500feet
downstreamofthemeterrunoranyproductionfacilities.Meterrunswillbe housed
and/orfenced.

f. Theoilandgas measurementfacilitieswillbe installedonthewelllocation.Theoiland
gas meterswillbe calibratedinplacepriortoanydeliveries.Tests formeteraccuracywill
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be conductedmonthlyforthefirstthreemonthsonnewmeterinstallationsandat least
quarterlythereafter.TheAOwillbe providedwitha date andtimefortheinitialmeter
calibrationandallfuturemeterprovingschedules.Acopyofthemetercalibrationreports
willbe submittedtotheVernalFieldOffice.Allmetermeasurementfacilitieswillconform
withOnshoreOilandGasOrderNo.4 forliquidhydrocarbonsandOnshoreOilandGas
OrderNo.5 fornaturalgasmeasurement.

g. Ifatanytimethefacilitieslocatedonpubliclandandauthorizedbythetermsofthelease
arenolongerincludedinthelease (duetoa contractionintheunitorotherlease orunit
boundarychange),BLMwillprocessa changeinauthorizationtotheappropriatestatute.
Theauthorizationwillbe subjecttoappropriaterentalorotherfinancialobligationas
determinedbytheauthorizedofficer.

h. Anynecessarypitswillbe properlyfencedtopreventanywildlifeentry.

i. Allsitesecurityguidelinesidentifiedin43 CFR3162.7regulationswillbe adheredto.

j. Alloff-leasestorage,off-leasemeasurement,orcomminglingon-leaseoroff-leasewill
have priorwrittenapprovalfromtheDistrictManager.

k. Allaccessroadswillbe maintainedas necessarytopreventerosionandaccommodate
year-roundtraffic.

l. The roadwillbe maintainedina safeuseablecondition.

m. Producedwaterwillbe storedina 300bblheated, insulatedtank,thenhauledtoa
commercialdisposalsitesuchas DisposalInc.,orBrennanBottom.

n. PipelineswillfollowtherouteshownonMapD. See Pipelinedetailattached.

5. LOCATIONANDTYPEOFWATERSUPPLY

a. The proposedwatersourcewillbe theNebeckerWaterServiceat theNebeckerWater
StationinMyton.TheWaterUseClaim# is43-1723.
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b. Waterwillbe hauledbyNebeckerWaterService tothelocationovertheaccessroads
shownonMapsAandB.

c. Nowaterwellwillbe drilledonthislease.

6. SOURCEOFCONSTRUCTIONMATERIAL

a. Sudaceandsubsoilmaterialsintheimmediateareawillbe utilized.

b. Anygravelusedwillbe obtainedfroma commercialsource,

c. The useofmaterialsunderBLMjurisdictionwillconformwith43 CFR3610.2.3.
Constructionmaterialwillnotbe locatedonlease.

d. Noconstructionmaterialswillbe removedfromFederalland.

7. METHODSOFHANDLINGWASTEDISPOSAL

a. The reservepitwillbe constructedso as nottoleak,break,orallowdischarge.

b. AttherequestoftheBLM,thereservepitwillbe linedwitha 12milliner. Iffracturedrock
is encountered,thepitwillbe firstlinedwithsufficientbedding(eitherstrawordid)to
coveranyrocks. The linerwilloverlapthepitwallsandbe coveredwithdirtand/orrocks
toholditinplace. Notrash,scrappipe,etc.,thatcouldpuncturethelinerwillbe disposed
ofinthepit.Morestringentprotectiverequirementsmaybe deemednecessarybythe
A.O.

c. Burningwillnotbe allowed.Alltrashwillbe containedina trashcageanditscontents
removedattheendofdrillingoperationsandhauledtoanapproveddisposalsight.

d. Afterfirstproduction,producedwastewaterwilfbe confinedtoa unlinedpitorstorage
tankfora periodnottoexceedninety(90)days. Duringthe90-dayperiod,inaccordance
withOnshoreOrderNo.7, anapplicationforapprovalofa permanentdisposalmethod
andlocation,alongwiththerequiredwateranalysis,willbe submittedfortheAO's
approval.Failuretofileanapplicationwithinthetimeallowedwillbe consideredan
incidentofnoncompliance.

PElk
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e. Drillcuttingsaretobe containedandburiedinthereservepit.

f. Anysaltsand/orchemicalswhicharean integralpartofthedrillingsystemwillbe
disposedofinthesamemanneras thedrillingfluid.

g. Achemicalporta-toiletwillbe furnishedwiththedrillingrig,

h. Theproducedfluidswillbe producedintoa testtankuntilsuchtimeas constructionof
productionfacilitiesiscompleted.Anyspillsofoil,gassaltwaterorotherproducedfluids
willbe cleanedupandremoved.

8. ANCILLARYFACILITIES

Therearenoairstrips,camps,orotherfacilitiesplannedduringthedrillingoftheproposedwell.

9. WELLSITELAYOUT

a. Theoperatororhis/hercontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficeat435/781-4400fody-
eight(48)hourspriortoconstructionactivities.

b. The reservepitwillbe locatedonthesouthwestsideofthe location.

c. Theflarepitwillbe locatedonthenorthsideofthereservepit,a minimumof100feet
fromthewellhead and30feetfromthereservepitfence.

d. Thestockpiledtopsoil(firstsixinches)willbe storedontheeastsideofthelocation.along
withCorners5 and6 nearthewellpad.Topsoilalongtheaccessroutewillbe windrowed
ontheuphillside.

e. Accesstothewellpad willbe fromthenorthas shownonthePit&Pad Layout.

f. SeeLocationLayoutfororientationofrig,crosssectionofdrillpadandcutsandfills.

g. The locationofmudtanks;reservepit,trashcage;piperacks;livingfacilitiesandsc
stockpileswillbe shownontheLocationLayout.

1%&
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h. AIIpitswillbe fencedaccordingtothefollowingminimumstandards:

1. 39 inchnetwireshallbe usedwithat leastonestrandorbarbedwireontopof
thenetwire(barbedwireis notnecessaryifpipeorsometypeofreinforcement
rodis attachedtothetopoftheentirefence).

2. The netwireshallbe nomorethan2-inchesabovetheground.The barbedwire
shallbe 3-inchesabovethenetwire. Totalheightofthefenceshallbe at least
42-inches.

3. Cornerpostsshallbecementedand/orbracedinsucha mannertokeepthe
fencetightatalltimes.

4. Standardsteel,wood,orpipepostsshallbe usedbetweenthecornerbraces.
Maximumdistancebetweenanytwopostsshallbe nogreaterthan16feet.

5. Allwireshallbe stretched,byusinga stretchingdevice,beforeit isattachedto
thecornerposts.

i. The reservepitfencingwillbe onthreesidesduringdrillingoperationsandonthefourth
sidewhentherigmovesoffthelocation.Pitswillbe fencedandmaintaineduntilcleanup.

10. PLANSFORRESTORATIONOFSURFACE

ProducingLocation

a. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,thelocationandsurroundingareawillbeclearedofall
unusedtubing,equipment,debris,materials,trashandjunknotrequiredforproduction.

b. Immediatelyuponwellcompletion,anyhydrocarbonsonthepitshallbe removedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.7-1.

c. Ifa plasticnylonreinforcedlineris useditshallbetornandperforatedbeforebackfillingof
the reservepit.
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d. The reservepitandthatpodionofthelocationnotneededforproductionfacilitiesor
operationswillbe recontouredtotheapproximatenaturalcontours.The reservepitwillbe
reclaimedwithin120daysfromthedate ofwellcompletion.Beforeanydirtworktakes
place,thereservepitmusthaveallfluidsandhydrocarbonsremovedandallcans,
barrels,pipe,etc.,willbe removed.

e. Reclamationofunuseddisturbedareasonthewellpadlaccess roadnolongerneededfor
operations,suchas cutslopes,andfillareaswillbe accomplishedbygrading,leveling
andseedingas recommendedbytheAuthorizedOfficer.Aseedmixturewillbe specified
bytheBureauofLandManagementintheirConditionsofApprovalforthesubjectwell.

Seedingwillbe performedimmediatelyafterthelocationhas beenreclaimedandthepit
has beenbackfilled,regardlessofthetimeofyear. Seedwillbebroadcastandwalkedin
witha dozer.

g. The topsoilstockpilewillbe seededas soonasthelocationhas been constructedwiththe
samerecommendedseedmix.Theseedwillbe walkedinwitha cat.

DryHole

h. Atsuchtimeasthewellis pluggedandabandoned,theoperatorshallsubmita
subsequentreportofabandonmentandBLMwillattachtheappropriatesurface
rehabilitationconditionsofapproval.

11. SURFACEOWNERSHIP

AccessRoads - ThemajorityoftheaccessroadsaremaintainedbytheCountyRoadDepartment
ortheBureauofLandManagement.

Wellpad - Thewellpad is locatedonlandsmanagedbytheBLM.

12. OTHERINFORMATION

a. AClassIllarcheologicalsurveyhas beenconductedbyGrandRiverInstitute.No
significantculturalresourceswerefoundandclearanceis recommended.Acopyofthis
reportis attached.

PEILIIT

ONSHOREORDERNO.1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GASCOEnergy,Inc./PannonianEnergy,Inc.
Federal #43-30-9-19 Lease No.UTU-37246
1980'FSLand659' FEL
NESE Section30,T9S- R19E SURFACEUSEPLAN
UintahCounty,Utah Page 9

d. The reservepitandthatpodionofthelocationnotneededforproductionfacilitiesor
operationswillbe recontouredtotheapproximatenaturalcontours.The reservepitwillbe
reclaimedwithin120daysfromthedate ofwellcompletion.Beforeanydirtworktakes
place,thereservepitmusthaveallfluidsandhydrocarbonsremovedandallcans,
barrels,pipe,etc.,willbe removed.

e. Reclamationofunuseddisturbedareasonthewellpadlaccess roadnolongerneededfor
operations,suchas cutslopes,andfillareaswillbe accomplishedbygrading,leveling
andseedingas recommendedbytheAuthorizedOfficer.Aseedmixturewillbe specified
bytheBureauofLandManagementintheirConditionsofApprovalforthesubjectwell.

Seedingwillbe performedimmediatelyafterthelocationhas beenreclaimedandthepit
has beenbackfilled,regardlessofthetimeofyear. Seedwillbebroadcastandwalkedin
witha dozer.

g. The topsoilstockpilewillbe seededas soonasthelocationhas been constructedwiththe
samerecommendedseedmix.Theseedwillbe walkedinwitha cat.

DryHole

h. Atsuchtimeasthewellis pluggedandabandoned,theoperatorshallsubmita
subsequentreportofabandonmentandBLMwillattachtheappropriatesurface
rehabilitationconditionsofapproval.

11. SURFACEOWNERSHIP

AccessRoads - ThemajorityoftheaccessroadsaremaintainedbytheCountyRoadDepartment
ortheBureauofLandManagement.

Wellpad - Thewellpad is locatedonlandsmanagedbytheBLM.

12. OTHERINFORMATION

a. AClassIllarcheologicalsurveyhas beenconductedbyGrandRiverInstitute.No
significantculturalresourceswerefoundandclearanceis recommended.Acopyofthis
reportis attached.

PEILIIT

ONSHOREORDERNO.1 CONFIDENTIAL- TIGHTHOLE
GASCOEnergy,Inc./PannonianEnergy,Inc.
Federal #43-30-9-19 Lease No.UTU-37246
1980'FSLand659' FEL
NESE Section30,T9S- R19E SURFACEUSEPLAN
UintahCounty,Utah Page 9

d. The reservepitandthatpodionofthelocationnotneededforproductionfacilitiesor
operationswillbe recontouredtotheapproximatenaturalcontours.The reservepitwillbe
reclaimedwithin120daysfromthedate ofwellcompletion.Beforeanydirtworktakes
place,thereservepitmusthaveallfluidsandhydrocarbonsremovedandallcans,
barrels,pipe,etc.,willbe removed.

e. Reclamationofunuseddisturbedareasonthewellpadlaccess roadnolongerneededfor
operations,suchas cutslopes,andfillareaswillbe accomplishedbygrading,leveling
andseedingas recommendedbytheAuthorizedOfficer.Aseedmixturewillbe specified
bytheBureauofLandManagementintheirConditionsofApprovalforthesubjectwell.

Seedingwillbe performedimmediatelyafterthelocationhas beenreclaimedandthepit
has beenbackfilled,regardlessofthetimeofyear. Seedwillbebroadcastandwalkedin
witha dozer.

g. The topsoilstockpilewillbe seededas soonasthelocationhas been constructedwiththe
samerecommendedseedmix.Theseedwillbe walkedinwitha cat.

DryHole

h. Atsuchtimeasthewellis pluggedandabandoned,theoperatorshallsubmita
subsequentreportofabandonmentandBLMwillattachtheappropriatesurface
rehabilitationconditionsofapproval.

11. SURFACEOWNERSHIP

AccessRoads - ThemajorityoftheaccessroadsaremaintainedbytheCountyRoadDepartment
ortheBureauofLandManagement.

Wellpad - Thewellpad is locatedonlandsmanagedbytheBLM.

12. OTHERINFORMATION

a. AClassIllarcheologicalsurveyhas beenconductedbyGrandRiverInstitute.No
significantculturalresourceswerefoundandclearanceis recommended.Acopyofthis
reportis attached.

PEILIIT



O O
ONSHOREORDERNO.1 CONFIDENTlAL- TIGHTHOLE
GASCOEnergy,Inc./PannonianEnergy,Inc.
Federal #43-30-9-19 Lease No.UTU-37246
1980'FSLand659' FEL
NESE Section30,T9S - R19E SURFACEUSEPLAN
UintahCounty,Utah Page 10

b. APaleontologicalResourceInventoryReportwillnotbe requiredbytheBureauofLand
Management.

c. Theoperatoris responsibleforinformingallpersonsintheareaswhoareassociatedwith
thisprojectthattheywillbesubjecttoprosecutionforknowinglydisturbinghistoricor
archaeologicalsites,orforcollectingartifacts,ifhistoricorarchaeologicalmaterialsare
uncoveredduringconstruction,theoperatoristoimmediatelystopworkthatmightfurther
disturbsuchmaterials,andcontacttheauthorizedofficer(AO).Withinfiveworkingdays
theAOwillinformtheoperatoras to:

-whether thematerialsappeareligiblefortheNationalRegisterofHistoricPlaces;

-the mitigationmeasurestheoperatorwilllikelyhave toundertakebeforethesitecanbe
used(assuminginsitupreservationis notnecessary);and

-a timeframefortheAOtocompleteandexpeditedreviewunder36 CFR800.11to
confirm,throughtheStateHistoricPreservationOfficer,thatthefindingsoftheAOare
correctandthatmitigationis appropriate.Iftheoperatorwishes,atanytime,torelocate
activitiestoavoidtheexpenseofmitigationand/orthedelaysassociatedwiththis
process,theAOwillassumeresponsibilityforwhateverrecordationandstabilizationof
theexposedmaterialsmaybe required.Otherwise,theoperatorwillbe responsiblefor
mitigationcosts. TheAOwillprovidetechnicalandproceduralguidelinesfortheconduct
ofmitigation.UponverificationfromtheAOthatrequiredmitigationhas beencompleted,
theoperatorwillthenbe allowedtoresumeconstruction.

d. Theoperatorwillcontrolnoxiousweedsalongrights-of-wayforroads,pipelines,wellsites,
orotherapplicablefacilities.Alistofnoxiousweedsmaybe obtainedfromtheBLM,or
theappropriateCountyExtensionOffice.OnBLMadministeredlanditis requiredthata
PesticideUseProposalshallbe submitted,andgivenapproval,priortotheapplicationof
herbicidesorotherpesticidesorpossiblehazardouschemicals.

e. Drillingrigsand/orequipmentusedduringdrillingoperationsonthiswellsitewillnotbe
stackedorstoredonFederalLandsafterthecónclusionofdrillingoperationsoratany
othertimewithoutBLMauthorization.However,ifBLMauthorizationis obtained,it is only
a temporarymeasure.
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f. Alllease and/orunitoperationswillbeconductedinsucha mannerthatfullcomplianceis
madewithallapplicablelaws,regulations,OnshoreOilandGasOrders,theapproved
planofoperations,andanyapplicableNoticetoLessees. Theoperatoris fully
responsiblefortheactionsofhissubcontractors.Acopyoftheseconditionswillbe
furnishedthefieldrepresentativetoinsurecompliance.

g. AcompletecopyoftheapprovedAPDshallbe on locationduringconstructionofthe
locationanddrillingactivities.

h. There willbenodeviationfromtheproposeddrillingand/orworkoverprogramwithout
priorapprovalfromtheAO.Safedrillingandoperatingpracticesmustbe observed.All
wells,whetherdrilling,producing,suspendedorabandonedwillbe identifiedin
accordancewith43 CFR3162.

i. "SundryNoticeandReportonWells"(Form3160-5)willbe filedforapprovalforall
changesofplansandotheroperationsinaccordancewith43 CFR3162.3-2.

j. Thispermitwillbe validfora periodofoneyearfromthedate ofapproval.Anextension
periodmaybe granted,ifrequested,priortotheexpirationoftheoriginalapprovalperiod.
Afterpermittermination,a newapplicationwillbe filedforapprovalforanyfuture
operations.

k. TheoperatororhiscontractorshallcontacttheBLMOfficesat435/781-440048 hours
priortoconstructionactivities,

l. The BLMOfficeshallbe notifieduponsitecompletionpriortomovingonthedrillingrig.

13. LESSEE'SOROPERATOR'SREPRESENTATIVEANDCERTIFICATION

PermitMatters Drillinq&CompletionMatters

PERMITC0INC. GASCOEnergy,Inc.
14421CountyRoad10 14 InvernessDriveEast,SuiteH-236
Ft.Lupton,CO80621 Englewood,CO80112
303/857-9999(0) John Longwell
303/857-0577(F) 303/483-0044(0)
LisaSmith 303/483-0011(F) * **
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CERTIFICATION

IherebycertifythatI,orpersonsundermydirectsupervision,have inspectedtheproposeddrill
siteandaccessroute;thatIamfamiliarwiththeconditionswhichpresentlyexist;thatthe
statementsmadeinthisplanare,tothebest ofmyknowledge,trueandcorrect;and,thatthe
workassociatedwiththeoperationsproposedhereinwillbe performedbyGASCOEnergy,Inc.
anditscontractorsandsubcontractorsinconformitywiththeplanandthetermsandconditions
underwhichit is approved.

Thisstatementissubjecttotheprovisionsof18.U.S.C.1001forthefilingofa falsestatement.

October31, 2003 /
Date: Lisa Smith- PERMITCOINC.

AuthorizedAgentfor:
GASCOEnergy,Inc./ PannonianEnergy,Inc.
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Project Name: Class III Cultural Resource Inventory Report on Four Procosed
Well Locations, Related Accesses and Pipeline Routes in Uintah and Duchesne
Counties, Utah, for Gasco, Inc. {GRI Project No. 2307]

State Proj. No.: UO3-GB-0252b Report Date: 4/22/03

Principal Investigator: Carl E. Conner

Field Supervisor(s): Carl E. Conner

Acreage Surveyed
Intensive: 55.7 acres Recon/Intuitive: acres

7.5' Series USGS Map Reference(s): Wilkin Ridge 1965; Moon Bottom 1985; Bic
Pack Mountain NW 1987; Big Pack Mountain NE 1987; and Uteland Butte 1964

Sites Reported

Archaeological Sites
Revisits (no inventory form update) 1 42UN1181

Revisits (updated IMACS site
inventory form attached) 0

New recordings (IMACS site inventory
form attached) 0

Total Count of Archaeological Sites O

Historic Structures (USHS 106 site info
form attached) 0

Total National Register Eligible sites 0

Paleontological Localities O

Checklist of Required Items

1. X 1 Copy of the Final Reports
2. Copy of 7.5' Series USGS Maps With.Surveyed/Excavated Area

Clearly Identified.
3. Completed IMACS Site Inventory Forms, Including

Parts A and B or C,
the IMACS Encoding Form,
Site Sketch Map,
Photographs, and
Copy of the Appropriate 7.5' Series USGS Map w/ the Site
Location Clearly Marked and Labeled w/ the Smithsonian No.

4. Paleontological locality form
5. X Completed "Cover Sheet" Accompanying Final Report and Survey
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FormUT-8100-3 UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Page 1 of_2
(December 2000) BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT

UTAH STATE OFFICE

Summary Report of Cultural
Resources Inspection Project No.: UO3-GB-0252bs

[GRI Project No. 2307]

1. Report Title: Class III Cultural Resource Inventory Report on Four Proposed Well

Locations, Related Accesses and Pipeline Routes in Uintah and Duchesne Counties, Utah

2. Report Date: 22 April 2003 3. Date(s) of Survey: 16* and 17* April 2003

4. Development Company: Gasco, Inc.

5. Responsible Institution: BLM Vernal District Office

6. Responsible Individuals Principal Investigator:Field Supervisor: Carl E. Conner

Report Author(s): Carl E. Conner

7. BLM Field Office: Book Cliffs and Diamond Mountain Field Offices (Vernal District

Office)

8. County(ies): Uintah and Duchesue

9. Fieldwork Location:

Proposed Wilkin Ridge State #13-32-10-17 : T.10S., R.17E., Section 32; S.L.B.M.

Proposed Algers Pass State #41-2-11-19: T.11S., R.19E., Section 2; S.L.B.M.

Proposed Little Canyon Federal #44-35-10-20: T.10S., R.20E., Section 35; S.L.B.M.

Proposed Federal #43-30-9-19: T.9S., R.19E., Section 30; S.L.B.M.

10. Record Search:

Location of Records Searched for BLM: BLM Vernal District Office Date: 4/16/2003

Location of Records Searched for State: Utah Div. of State History Date: 4/16/2003

11. Description of Proposed Project: 4 proposed pads for well locations, and related access

and pipeline routes

12. Description of Examination Procedures: A 100 percent pedestrian cultural resources
inventory of the proposed well locations was made by a two-person crew walking
concentric circles spaced 20 meters apart around the staked centers to cover a 750 feet
diameter, or a 10-acre plot. The related access and pipeline routes not included within the
10-acre study plots were surveyed by walking four parallel transects spaced at 10m
intervals and centered on the flagged lines to cover corridors 100 feet wide. A total of
about 55.7 acres was intensively
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Abstract

Grand River Institute conducted a Class III cultural resources inventory of four
proposed well locations, related accesses and pipeline routes in Uintah and Duchesne
Counties, Utah, for Gasco, Inc. under BLM Antiquities Permit No. 03UT-54939 and Utah
Division of State History (UDSH) Project Authorization No. UO3-GB-0252bs. This work
was done to meet requirements of Federal and State laws that protect cultural resources.

A files search conducted through the BLM Vernal District Office on 16 April 2003
indicated site 42UN1181 was previously recorded adjacent to the proposed Fed. #43-30-9-19
well location. A search of the Utah Division of State History site files also on April 16th
indicated no sites were previously recorded on the state lands in the study areas.

Field work was performed on the 16*and 17* of April. A total of about 55.7 acres
(BLM 24.8 acres, State 30.9 acres) was inspected. The previously recorded site (42UNll81)
was relocated and will be avoided by the currently proposed project. No significant cultural
resources were encountered during the inventory (although an isolated find was recorded
along the pipeline route for the proposed Algers Pass State # 41-2-11-19). Accordingly,
archaeological clearance is recommended for all the proposed wells, new roads, and
pipelines.
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Introduction

At the request of Gasco, Inc., the Bureau of Land Management and the State of Utah,
Grand River Institute (GRI) conducted a Class III cultural resources inventory of four
proposed well locations, related accesses and pipeline routes in Uintah and Duchesne
Counties, Utah, under BLM Antiquities Permit No. 03UT-54939 and Utah Division of State
History (UDSH) Project AuthorizationNo. UO3-GB-0252bs. A files search conducted
through the BLM Vernal District Office on 16 April 2003 indicated site 42UNll81 was
previously recorded adjacent to the proposed Fed. #43-30-9-19 well location. A search of
the Utah Division of State History site files also on April 16th indicated no sites were
previously recorded on state lands in the study areas. The file searches, survey and report
were prepared by Carl E. Conner (Principal Investigator) and Barbara J. Davenport of GRI.

The survey was done to meet requirements of the Federal Land Policy and
Management Act of 1976, the National Historic Preservation Act as amended in 1992, and
the National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) of 1969. These laws are concerned with the
identification, evaluation, and protection of fragile, non-renewable evidences of human
activity, occupation and endeavor reflected in districts, sites, structures, artifacts, objects,
ruins, works of art, architecture, and natural features that were of importance in human
events. Such resources tend to be localized and highly sensitive to disturbance.

Location of Project Area

The study area lies between 35.0 and 55.0 miles south-southeast of Vernal, Utah.
Table 1 lists the specific well locations, accesses and pipeline route data. Figures 1 through
4 show the study areas and the locations of the recorded cultural resources.

Table 1. Location of wells, and related new roads and pipelines.

Well/Access/Pipeline Location

Wilkin Ridge State #13-32-10-17 T.10S., R.17E., Section 32
[Existing access]
(Pipeline within 10-acre study area)

Algers Pass State #41-2-11-19 T.llS., R.19E., Section 2
[Existing access]
Pipeline (0.4mile)

Little Canyon Federal #44-35-10-20 T.10S., R.20E., Section 35
Access (0.9mile) [no pipeline staked]

Federal #43-30-9-19 [Existing access] T.9S., R.19E., Section 30
(Pipeline within 10-acre survey area)
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Figure 1. Project location map (1 of 4) for the Class III cultural resources inventory for four
proposed well locations, related access and pipeline routes in Uintah and Duchesne
Counties, Utah, for Gasco, Inc. Area surveyed for the Wilkin Ridge State#13-32-10-17 is
highlighted. [GRI Project No. 2307, 04/22/2003]
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Figure 2. Project location map (2 of 4) for the Class III cultural resources inventory for four
proposed well locations, related access and pipeline routes in Uintab and Duchesne
Counties, Utah, for Gasco, Inc. Areas surveyed for the proposed Algers Pass State
#41-2-11-19and its related pipeline route are highlighted. [GRI Project No. 2307,
04/22/2003]
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Figure 3. Project location map (3 of 4) for the Class III cultural resources inventory for four
proposed well locations, related access and pipeline routes in Uintah and Duchesne
Counties, Utah, for Gasco, Inc. Areas surveyed for the proposed Little Canyon Fed.
#44-35-10-20 and its related access route are highlighted.[GRI Project No. 2307]
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Figure 4. Project location map (4 of 4) for the Class III cultural resources inventory for four
proposed well locations, related access and pipeline routes in Uintah and Duchesne
Counties, Utah, for Gasco, Inc. Area surveyed for the proposed Fed. #43-30-9-19 is
highlighted. [GRI Project No. 2307, 04/22/2003]
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Figure 4. Project location map (4 of 4) for the Class III cultural resources inventory for four
proposed well locations, related access and pipeline routes in Uintah and Duchesne
Counties, Utah, for Gasco, Inc. Area surveyed for the proposed Fed. #43-30-9-19 is
highlighted. [GRI Project No. 2307, 04/22/2003]
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Environment

The project areas are within the major geologic subdivision of the Colorado Plateau
known as the Uinta Basin Section. In Utah, this section extends from the Uinta Mountains
on the north to the Book Cliffs on the south. It is a broad downwarp into which Quaternary-
and Tertiary-age deposits were made from the surrounding mountains which include
Holocene and Pleistocene pediment deposits, and Eocene-age fluvial and lacustrine
sedimentary rocks (Rigby 1976:xi). Physiographically, the basin includes the Uinta basin in
the north portion and the Book Cliffs/Roan Plateau in the south portion. The lower Uinta
Formation is the bedrock of the study area. Holocene and Pleistocene-age alluvium and
colluvium occur as a veneer over the Uinta. It consists of channel and flood-plain stream
deposits. Soils encountered were rocky, shaley, silty, and sandy loams, which are in general
formed in residuum from the underlying formation. However, dunes are common in this
region as well.

Elevation in the project area averages 4800 feet. The terrain is characterized as
bench land that is cut by dendritic washes. Vegetation is a shadscale desert community that
includes greasewood, rabbitbrush, ephedra, snakeweed, and Indian ricegrass. Regional
faunal inhabitants include deer, antelope, elk, black bear, coyote, mountain lion, cottontails,
jackrabbits, and various raptores.

A cool, mid-latitude steppe climate prevails. Annual precipitation of this elevation
range is between 10 and 14 inches. Temperatures range from 100°F in the summer to 40°F
in January. Paleoenvironmental data are scant, but it is generally agreed that gross climatic
conditions have remained fairly constant over the last 12,000 years. However, changes in
effective moisture, and cooling-warmingtrends probably affected the prehistoric occupation
of the region.

Files Search

Regional archaeological studies suggest nearly continuous human occupation of
northeastern Utah for the past 12,000 years. Evidence of the Paleoindian Tradition, the
Archaic Tradition, Fremont Culture, and Protohistoric/Historic Utes has been found.
Historic records suggest occupation or use by EuroAmerican trappers, settlers, miners, and
ranchers as well. Overviews of the prehistory and history of the region are provided in the
Utah BLM Cultural Resource Series No. 5, Sample inventoriesof Oil and Gas Fields in
Eastern Utah (Nickens and Larralde 1980).

A search of the Utah Division of State History site files also on April 16th indicated
no sites were previously recorded on the state lands in the study areas although projects were
conducted within their 10-acreplots (U-80-UB-0305, Wilkin Ridge State #13-32-10-17; and
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U-87-AF-0636 and U-91-GB-0668 Algers Pass State #41-2-11-19). A files search
conducted through the BLM Vernal District Office on 16 April 2003 indicated site
42UNl181 was previously recorded adjacent to the proposed Fed. #43-30-9-19 well
location. A paleontological records search indicated no localities have been reported for the
State lands in the study areas.

Site 42UN1181 is a large lithic quarry [procurement locality] that occurs
wherever desert pavement [pediment deposits] is exposed in wash areas and on
hillsides. It covers the major portion of Section 29 and the central part of the west
half of Section 28 (T9S, Rl9E). No features were observed other than crude walls
on a butte on the western edge of the site (previously recorded as 42UN863).
Topography, slope, aspect, etc. change across the site, as it covers a large area. Most
artifacts are quartzite primary and secondary flakes and cores. (Two types of cores
are evident: a cobble with bifacial flakes taken off bifacially and a cobble with one
end knocked off and subsequent flakes removed.)

During a well pad inventory by Sagebrush Archaeological Consultants in
April 1992, several small areas of lag cobble deposits were crossed by a survey along
an existing two track road proposed for an access to the well pad. The areas were
generally in low lying ponding areas or where sandstone bedrock exposures occur.
Most of the gravels are quartzite, quartz and mudstone cobbles with no evidence of
alteration. However, about five percent of the materials do show evidence of
splitting and flaking, possibly for evaluation of the quality of the material or for
creation of primary flakes for immediate use or later refinement into formal tools.
Also present in these fields are some cores and primary flakes. There is no evidence
of depth or concentrations of culturally altered materials.

Also found in a large cobble field was a possible hearth feature. It consists of
four small boulders arranged in a rectangular pattern enclosing a small open area of
sterile clay soils within a pebble/cobble field. There is also another rock near the
corner of the feature. The feature measures about 120 cm. by 90 cm. in size. It may
represent the remains of a former prehistoric hearth feature. No tools or other
associated cultural evidence was found in the area.

This site was revisited in yr2000 as part of project U00-GB-0441b. Evidence of lithic
procurement activities was observed within the natural gravel deposits of site 42UNll81, as
originally documented. It was field evaluated under both the original recording and the
yr2000 project as non-significant.

Study Objectives

The purpose of the study was to identify and record all cultural resources within -he

areas of potential impact and to assess their significance and eligibilitv to the National
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Register of Historic Places (NRHP). The statements of significance included in this report
are field assessments made in support of recommendations to the BLM and State Historic
Preservation Officer (SHPO), and the final determination of site significance is made by the
BLM in consultation with the SHPO.

Paleontological resources were also considered in the inspection. However, a final
evaluation of those resources must be provided by a paleontologist permitted by Utah.

Field Methods

A Class III, 100% pedestrian, cultural resources survey of the proposed well
locations was made by walking a series of concentric circles around the flagged centers to
diameters of 750 feet. The related access and pipeline routes not included within the 10-acre
study plots were surveyed by walking four parallel transects spaced at 10m intervals and
centered on the flagged lines to cover corridors 100 feet wide. A total of about 55.7 acres
was intensively surveyed.

Cultural resources were sought as surface exposures and were characterized as sites
or isolated finds. Sites were defmed by the presence of six or more artifacts and/or
significant feature(s) indicative of patterned human activity. Isolated finds were defined by
the presence of 1 to 5 artifacts apparently of surficial nature. Cultural resources encountered
were to be recorded to standards set by the Preservation Office of the Utah Division of State
History (UDSH).

The basic approach GRI uses in data collection is the mapping of observed artifacts
and features using Garmin GPS III Plus units. Photographs are taken of each site and
include a general view and specific artifacts or features. One crew member would map,
while the other crew members took notes regarding the sites' soil, vegetation, geology and
cultural artifacts or architecture. Field notes and photo negatives are filed at Grand River
Institute, while the photographs are submitted to the BLM and UDSH.

Study Findings and Management Recommendations

As expected, cultural resources were encountered during the survey. A very low
density scatter of debris was observed along the bordor of site 42UNll81 along the east side
of the 10-acre study area for Fed. #43-30-9-19. Since the site was previously evaluated as
non-significant, and since bedrock formation was exposed throughout the study block the
related cultural materials were given no further consideration by this project. That bedrock
exposure exhibited "float" fossil bone, but such did not appear to represent significant
deposits. Similar "float" was observed at the Algers Pass State #41-2-11-19. In the pipeline
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survey corridor that runs west of the latter cited study area an isolated find was recorded that
consists of two small biface thinning flakes of white chert. This isolated find probably
represents refurbishing of a biface-likely for use in butchering activities. It was field
evaluated as non-significant (see Appendix A for IF form). Since no significant cultural
resources were encountered during the inventory, archaeological clearance is recommended
for all the proposed wells, new roads, and pipelines.

References
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County, Utah. In: Utah BLM Cultural Resource Series No. 11. Bureau of
Land Management, Salt Lake City.

Rigby, J. Keith
1. 1976 Northern Colorado Plateau. Kendall/Hunt Publishing Company.

Dubuque.

O O

survey corridor that runs west of the latter cited study area an isolated find was recorded that
consists of two small biface thinning flakes of white chert. This isolated find probably
represents refurbishing of a biface-likely for use in butchering activities. It was field
evaluated as non-significant (see Appendix A for IF form). Since no significant cultural
resources were encountered during the inventory, archaeological clearance is recommended
for all the proposed wells, new roads, and pipelines.

References

Larralde, Signa L. and Susan M. Chandler
1980 Archaeological inventory in the Seep Ridge Cultural Study Tract, Uintah

County, Utah. In: Utah BLM Cultural Resource Series No. 11. Bureau of
Land Management, Salt Lake City.

Rigby, J. Keith
1. 1976 Northern Colorado Plateau. Kendall/Hunt Publishing Company.

Dubuque.

O O

survey corridor that runs west of the latter cited study area an isolated find was recorded that
consists of two small biface thinning flakes of white chert. This isolated find probably
represents refurbishing of a biface-likely for use in butchering activities. It was field
evaluated as non-significant (see Appendix A for IF form). Since no significant cultural
resources were encountered during the inventory, archaeological clearance is recommended
for all the proposed wells, new roads, and pipelines.

References

Larralde, Signa L. and Susan M. Chandler
1980 Archaeological inventory in the Seep Ridge Cultural Study Tract, Uintah

County, Utah. In: Utah BLM Cultural Resource Series No. 11. Bureau of
Land Management, Salt Lake City.

Rigby, J. Keith
1. 1976 Northern Colorado Plateau. Kendall/Hunt Publishing Company.

Dubuque.



O e

APPENDIX A: IF Form

O e

APPENDIX A: IF Form

O e

APPENDIX A: IF Form



O O

ISOLATED FIND RECORD

1)Resource No. IF #1 2)Temp.No. 2307:IF-1 3)County Uintah
I.LOCATION
4)Legal Location SE 1/4, NW 1/4, NW 1/4, NE 1/4, Sec._2_ T 11S R 19E PM SLBM
S Quad: Name Moon Bottom Size 7.5' Date 1985
6)UTM:Zonell; § g 1 7 4mE, 4 4 1 6 6 5 3mN Attach copy of portion of USGS Quad
II.ARCHAEOLOGICAL DATA:
7)Artifacts: 2 biface thinning flakes of white chert

8)Inferred function/description: Resharpening of biface for butchering?
9)Cultural Affiliation Unknown Prehistoric Date Period Unknown
10)IF Dimensions X X cm
III.ENVIRONMENTAL DATA:
11)Elevation 5440 ft. 1658 m. 12)soil tan/brown sandv soil
13)Topography oven, flat, slight saddle 4)Slope:Site 0-2 surrounding 2-10

15)Nearest water unnamed intermittent drainage dist. 40 m direct. W
Nearest perm. water unnamed dist. 350m direct. SW

16)Vegetation on site 4-wing saltbrush 17)Surrounding veg. Same
Additional Comments:
IV.ADDITIONAL INFOEKATION: (narrative, drawings, sketch man)
Section determination was from SE corner of Section 2.

V.REFERENCE DATA:
18)Collection: yes___ no_X__ describe
19)Repository 20)Landowner Utah State
21)Report Title GRI Proi. No. 2307 CRI 4 wells for Gasco, Inc.
22)Recorder Conner/Davenoort
23)Affiliation Grand River Institute, Grand Junction, CO 24)Date
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PIPEUNEINFORMATION
Gasco Fed43-30-9-19

1. The type of pipeline is a gathering system.

2. The outside diameters (O.D.)of all pipe is 6 5/8" inches.

3. The anticipated production throughthe line is 3000 McFper day.

4. The anticipatedmaximum testpressure is 900 psi.

5. The anticipated operating pressure is 150-200 psi.

6. The type of pipe is Steel.

7. The methodof couplingis welded.

8. No other pipelines are to be associated in same trench.

9. No other objectsare to be associated in same trench.

10. The total length of pipeline is approximately600 feet.

11. The pipe willbe laid on the surface of the ground.

12. The construction widthneeded for total surface disturbingactivitiesis 30 feet.

13. The estimateoftotal acreage involvingallsurfacedisturbingactivities.41 acres

14. Valves will be located at each end and a sphere launcher at the well site, if
necessary.

15. Reclamation procedures willinclude recontouring to original surface features, and
reseeding as required by the BLM.
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GAS00 ,

EnergyInc '

Bureau Of Land Management
vernal Field office
170 S. 500 E.
Vernal, UT 84078

Attn: Minerals

Re: All Wells
uintah county, utah

Gentlemen:

This letter is to inform you that Permitco Inc. is
authorized to act as Agent and to sign documents on behalf of
(Company Name) when necessary for filing county, state and
federal _permits including onshore Order No. 1, Right of way
applications, etc., for the above mentioned well.

It should be understood that Permitco is acting as Agent
only in those matters stated above and is not responsible for
drilling, completion, production or compliance with regulations.

ago £8e , & Paneamin 6
.

(company Name)
agrees to accept fu responsibility for ope ations conducted in
order to drill, complete and produce the above-mentioned well.

Sincerely,

o '. ngwell
o ratio 5
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GASCO ENERGY, INC.

FEDERAL #43-30-9-19
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 30, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM LOCATION STAKE TO CORNER #1 CAMERA ANGLE: EASTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW OF RE GINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATIONPHOTOS 3 18 03 PHOTO
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 ^ =

sinceiw4 435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com TAKENBY:K.K. DRAWNBY:J.LG SED:
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LOCATION LAYOUT FOR Proposed Access

Prevailing Winds FEDERAL #43-30--9-19 N°°d
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Dev. Graded Ground at Location Stake - 4810.4 as s.. zoo z... . v.s..c. us.» esove · tsas;
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GASCO ENERGY, IN
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SECTION 30, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.
1 = 50' 1980° FSL 659' FEL

SCALE: 1" = 50'
DATE: 3-17-03
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Preconstruction
Grade
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Slop e= 1 1/2: 1
P ) Finished Grade

CUT
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35' 135'

CU 7 F/LL
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il should not be
Stripped Below Finished STA 0+00
Grade on Substructure Areo.

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES
CUT EXCESS MATERIAL AFTER
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?¾3]UKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 11/03/2003 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-35343

WELL NAME: FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

OPERATOR: PANNONIAN ENERGY INC ( N1815 )

CONTACT: LISA SMITH PHONE NUMBER: 303-483-0044

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
NESE 30 090S 190E

SURFACE: 1980 FSL 0659 FEL Tech Review Initials Date

BOTTOM: 1980 FSL 0659 FEL Engineering
UINTAH

PARIETTE BENCH ( 640 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-3 7246

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal LATITUDE: 40.00000

PROPOSED FORMATION: CSLGT LONGITUDE: 109.81569

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

\/ Plat R649-2-3.

\/ Bond:Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit

(No. UT-1233 )
Potash (Y/N) \/ R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 siting:460 From otr/Qtr a 920'Between welis

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
UNo.43-1723 )

Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No:(Date: ) Eff Date:
Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS:
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OPERATOR PANNONIAN ENERGY INC (N18l5)

SEC.30 T.95, R.l9E

FIELD: PARIETTE BENCH (640)

COUNTY:UINTAH

SPACING:R649-3-2 / GENERAL SITING

Unit Status
WasGASlNJECTION EXPLORATORY Utah OilGas and Mining

· GASETORAGE GAS STORAGE
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WATER DISPOSAI_ TERMINATED TERMINATED SDATE:
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0 0 4 StaÊof Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
1594 West North Ternple, Suite 1210

3fichael O. Leavitt
PO Box 145801

Governor Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Robert L. Morgan (801) 538-5340 telephone
Executive Director (801) 359-3940 fax

Lowell P Braxton (801) 538-7223 TTY
Division Director www.nr.utah.gov

November 5, 2003

Pannonian Energy, Inc.
14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #H236
Englewood, CO 80112

Re: Federal 43-30-9-19 Well, 1980' FSL, 659' FEL, NE SE, Sec. 30, T. 9 South, R. 19 East,
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-35343.

'erely,

ohn R. Baza
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office
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O O
Operator: Pannonian Energy, Inc.

Well Name & Number Federal 43-30-9-19

API Number: 43-047-35343
Lease: UTU-37246

Location: NE SE Sec. 30 T. 9 South R. 19 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the

O O
Operator: Pannonian Energy, Inc.

Well Name & Number Federal 43-30-9-19

API Number: 43-047-35343
Lease: UTU-37246

Location: NE SE Sec. 30 T. 9 South R. 19 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the

O O
Operator: Pannonian Energy, Inc.

Well Name & Number Federal 43-30-9-19

API Number: 43-047-35343
Lease: UTU-37246

Location: NE SE Sec. 30 T. 9 South R. 19 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the



O - O
.

Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease serialNo.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-37246

ÔQ$ APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER "Adian,Allottee or Tribe Name

1a. Type of Work: DRILL REENTER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

N/A
8, Lease Name and Well No.

b. Type of Well; Oil Well Gas Well O er Single Zone Multiple Zone Federal #43-30-9-19

2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044 14 inverness DriveEast, Suite #H236 9· API Well No.

GASCOEnergy, Inc./Pannonian Energy,Inc. Englewood,CO80112
3. Name of Agent 303-857-9999 14421CountyRoad 10 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

Permitco \nc. - Agent Fort Lupton,CO80621 Wildcat
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements *) l1. Sec., T,, R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area

At surface 1980'FSLand659' FEL Section30,T9S-R19E

At proposed prod, zone NESE
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately25.3 milesSoutheastofMyton,UT Uintah UT
15. Distance tiom proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17, Spacing Unit< edicated to this well

location to nearest
property or lease line, n - 659'(Also to nearest drig. unit line,if any) 600 N/A

11 Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, drillmg, completed,
applied for, on this lease, ft. Appf0x.4000' 11,500' Bond#UT-1233

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4810' GL January 15,2004 30 Days
24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:
RECE!VED

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an exist bpn og tp ge
2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands. 5. Operator certification Div.OF OR. 3AS & MININ
SUPO shall be tiled with the appropriate Forest Sen ice Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized office,

25. Signature Name (Printed/Tvped) ' Date

Title
( LISa L.Smith 10/31/2003

Authorized Agentfor GASCOEnergy,Inc./Pannonian Energy,Inc.
Approved by (Signature) Name (Printed/liped) Date

Tide AssistantField Manager lomce
MineralResources '

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable utle to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to

conduct operations thereon.

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Tide 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212. make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
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Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease serialNo.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-37246

ÔQ$ APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER "Adian,Allottee or Tribe Name

1a. Type of Work: DRILL REENTER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

N/A
8, Lease Name and Well No.

b. Type of Well; Oil Well Gas Well O er Single Zone Multiple Zone Federal #43-30-9-19

2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044 14 inverness DriveEast, Suite #H236 9· API Well No.

GASCOEnergy, Inc./Pannonian Energy,Inc. Englewood,CO80112
3. Name of Agent 303-857-9999 14421CountyRoad 10 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

Permitco \nc. - Agent Fort Lupton,CO80621 Wildcat
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements *) l1. Sec., T,, R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area

At surface 1980'FSLand659' FEL Section30,T9S-R19E

At proposed prod, zone NESE
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately25.3 milesSoutheastofMyton,UT Uintah UT
15. Distance tiom proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17, Spacing Unit< edicated to this well

location to nearest
property or lease line, n - 659'(Also to nearest drig. unit line,if any) 600 N/A

11 Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, drillmg, completed,
applied for, on this lease, ft. Appf0x.4000' 11,500' Bond#UT-1233

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4810' GL January 15,2004 30 Days
24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:
RECE!VED

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an exist bpn og tp ge
2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands. 5. Operator certification Div.OF OR. 3AS & MININ
SUPO shall be tiled with the appropriate Forest Sen ice Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized office,

25. Signature Name (Printed/Tvped) ' Date

Title
( LISa L.Smith 10/31/2003

Authorized Agentfor GASCOEnergy,Inc./Pannonian Energy,Inc.
Approved by (Signature) Name (Printed/liped) Date

Tide AssistantField Manager lomce
MineralResources '
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COAs Page 1 of 5
Well No.: Federal 43-30-9-19

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Cornpany/Operator: Pannonian Energy, Inc.

Well Name & Number: Federal 43-30-9-19

API No. 43-047-36 i

Lease Number: U-37246

Location: NESE Sec. L T._9S_R. 19E

Agreement: N/A

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval
for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease that would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well is
being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for infornation.

1. DRILLING PROGRAM

l. Estimated Depth at Which Oil, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearing Zones are Expected
to be Encountered

Report ALL water shows and water-bearing sands to John Mayers of this office prior to setting
the next casing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies of State of Utah form
OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected, submit samples to this office
along with any water analyses
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Well No.; Federal 43-30-9-19

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLM at onsite)
encountered during drilling will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas
shows will be tested to deternine commercial potential.

2. Pressure Control Equipment

Chart recorders shall be used for all pressure tests.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while drilling
and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

3. Casing Program and Auxiliary Equipment

None

4. Mud Program and Circulating Medium

None

5. Corine, Logging and Testing Program

A Cement Bond Log will be required from production casing shoe to the intermediate casing.

Please submit to this office, in LAS format, an electronic copy of all logs run on this well
This submission will replace the requirement for submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

6. Notifications of Operations

None

7. Other Information

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on lease or off-lease will have
prior written approval from the AO.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location. The oil and gas
meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries and tested for meter accuracy at least
quarterly thereafter. The AO will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will

be submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform to
Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 5 for
natural gas
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Well No.: Federal 43-30-9-19

APD approval is valid for a period of one (1) year from the signature date. An extension period
may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Ed Forsman (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435)
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Well No.: Federal 43-30-9-19

EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPT EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, they are not necessarily hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids

Gas plant cooling tower cleaning wastes

Painting wastes

Oil and gas service company wastes, such as empty drums, drum rinsate, vacuum truck rinsate,

sandblast media, painting wastes, spend solvents, spilled chemicals, and waste acids

Vacuum truck and drum rinsate from trucks and drums, transporting or containing nonexempt

waste

Refinery wastes

Liquid and solid wastes generated by crude oil and tank bottom reclaimers

Used equipment lubrication oils

Waste compressor oil, filters, and blowdown

Used hydraulic fluids

Waste solvents

Waste in transportation pipeline-related pits

Caustic or acid cleaners

Boiler cleaning wastes

Boiler refractory bricks

Incinerator ash

Laboratory wastes

Sanitary wastes

Pesticide wastes

Radioactive tracer wastes

Drums, insulation and miscellaneous
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Well No.; Federal 43-30-9-19

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
FOR THE SURFACE USE PROGRAM OF THE

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

-Due to the well being located near the Sheep Wash 100 year floodplain, the reserve pit shall
be lined first with a felt liner prior to installing the nylon re-enforced plastic liner.

-The location topsoil pile shall be windrowed as shown on the cut sheet and seeded with the
following seed mix:

Shadscale Atriplex confertifolia 3 lbs/acre
Gardner saltbush Atriplex gardneri 3 lbs/acre
Indian ricegrass Oryzopsis hymenoides 3 lbs/acre
Crested wheatgrass Agropyron cristatum (hycest) 3 lbs/acre

-Seeding shall take place immediately after the soil is piled by broadcasting the seed, then
walking the topsoil pile with the dozer to plant the seed.

-All poundages are in Pure Live Seed.

-Topsoil will not be used for the construction of tank dikes or any other location needs.
It shall be left in place for use in the final reclamation process.

-Once the reserve pit is dry, it should be filled, recontoured, topsoil spread, and seeded in
the same manner discussed above.

-If cultural resources or fossilized materials are found during the construction of the well
location, the contractor shall cease work and call the BLM authorized officer to receive
instructions prior to continuing
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNAflON AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITOr CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals todrillneW wells, signilicantly deepen existing wells below curent bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals-
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBEROIL WELL GAS WELL B OTHER see attached list
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR; 9. API NUMBER

Gasco Production Company gg§ ¶f
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER- 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
114 Invemess Dr. East criv Englewood STATE ZIP 80112 (303) 483-0044

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFAŒ: COUNTY:

QTRJQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

99. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

NOTICE OF INTI¯NT ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(submitin Duplicat•) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Apprwmate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEWCONSillUCTlON TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER- name change
coNVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent detalis including dates, depths. Volumes, etc.

Pannonian Energy, Inc. changed its name to Gasco Production Company effective February 24, 2004

RECE1VED

APR22 2004
DN.0F OIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE PRI T Land Man ger

(TMs space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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Do not use thisform for proposals todrillneW wells, signilicantly deepen existing wells below curent bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to

drillhorizontal laterais. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals-
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBEROIL WELL GAS WELL B OTHER see attached list
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR; 9. API NUMBER

Gasco Production Company gg§ ¶f
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER- 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
114 Invemess Dr. East criv Englewood STATE ZIP 80112 (303) 483-0044

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFAŒ: COUNTY:

QTRJQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

99. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

NOTICE OF INTI¯NT ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(submitin Duplicat•) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Apprwmate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEWCONSillUCTlON TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER- name change
coNVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent detalis including dates, depths. Volumes, etc.

Pannonian Energy, Inc. changed its name to Gasco Production Company effective February 24, 2004

RECE1VED

APR22 2004
DN.0F OIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE PRI T Land Man ger

(TMs space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: fdf
API number: 5 -

Location: }J(
Company that filed original application:
Date original permit was issued: i \ 6
Company that permit was issued to: CMyt

Check Desired Action:one

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as ownerwith legal rights to drillon theproperty, hereby verifies thatthe information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill,remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner oftheapplicationaccepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drillon the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verlfled. Yes No

If located on private land, has the ownershipchanged?

Ifso, has the surface agreement been updated?

Have any wells been drilled in thevicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has theapproved source ofwater for drillingchanged?
Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?
Is bonding stillin place, which covers thisproposed well? Bond No. I\ // / /O 2 3 (

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drillthatis being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill,Form 3, as appropriate,with

Representing (companyname) Div.0F OlL GAS MINING

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for
Permit to Drilt
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH

0 08 2
3. FILE

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/24/2004
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N1815-Pannonian Energy, Inc. N2575-Gasco Production Company

114 Invemess Dr E 114 Inverness Dr E
Englewood, CO 80112 Englewood, CO 80l12

Phone: 1-(303) 483-0044 Phone: 1-(303) 483-0044

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
GATE CYN 31-21-l l-15 21 110S 150E 4301332391 / 13787 State GW DRL C
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 State GW APD

- WILKIN RIDGE STATE 12-32-10-17 32 1005 170E 4301332447 / 14033 State GW DRL C
y..STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 State GW NEW C

e FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 / 13601 Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 Federal GW APD
FED 42-21-9-19 21 0905 190E 4304735405 Federal GW APD C
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 Federal GW APD C
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 af 13640 Federal GW P
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 , Federal GW APD C
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734111 | 13441 Federal GW P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 g/ 13455 Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 Federal GW APD C
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 / 13641 Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 Federal GW NEW C
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 Federal GW APD C
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 06 100S 190E 4304734813 Federal GW LA C
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 . Federal GW APD C
LAFKAS FED 1-3 03 110S 200E 4304731178 / 1367 Federal GW S
WILLOW CREEK UNIT 2 05 110S 200E 4304731818 / 11604 Federal GW TA
HILL FEDERAL 1-10 10 110S 200E 4304731026 | 1368 Federal GW TA

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from theFORMER operator on: 4/22/2004

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/22/2004

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 4/21/2004

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: ***

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: *** 4/21/2004

Gasco Prod Pannonian FORM 4B,xis

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH

0 08 2
3. FILE
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0 08 2
3. FILE
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Gasco Prod Pannonian FORM 4B,xis



O O
6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM in process BIA

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: in process

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/29/2004

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/29/2004

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: n/a

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 4/22/2004

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 4127764

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 4127759

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 4127765

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number n/a

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of thischange on: N/A

COMMENTS:
This is a corporatename changewithin the same corporation and it's subsidiaries

Gasco Prod Pannonian FORM 4B.xis

O O
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WELLNAME API $ LOCATION COUNTY StatusFederal 23-29 #1 43-047-34111 NESW Sen. 29 T98 R19E Uintah PFederal 42-29-9-10 43-047-34202 SENE, Sec. 29, TSS, R19E Ulniah PL Federal 22-22-9-19 43447-3400T SENW Sec. 22 TOS,Ri9E Uinlah PFederat 32,31+10 43-047-34201 SWNE Sec. 31 TOS,R19E Uintah PPase Unit#1 43447-31824 SWNE Sec. T118, R1eE UIntah PGale Canyon State 31-21-11-15 43-013-32301 NWNE, Sec. 21. T11S, RißE Duchesne DRLWilkin Stale 12-32-1 17 43413-32447 SWNW,Sec. 32 T10S R17E Duchesne DRLWiionCreek #2 43-047-31818 SESW Sec. 6 TiiS ?t20E Uintah TAHRFederai #1-10 43-047-31026 NESWSec. 10 T118 R20E Ulntah TAFederal 2 21-9-19 43-047-34190 NESW Sec. 21 TOS,R19E Uintah PFederal 43-30*19 43-047-35343 NESE, Sec. 30 TOS,R19E Uintah APOGale Canyon State 41-20-11-15 4341&32475 NENE, Soc. 20, TiiS,R15E Duchesne APDFederal 11-21+19 43.047-34008 NWNW,Sec. 21, TOSR19E Uintah APDFederal 11-22..0-19 43-047-35404 NWNW,Sec. TOSR19E Uintah APDFederal 22-3 10-18 43447-34024 SENW,Sec. 30 T10S R18E Uintah APDState 24-16-9-19 43-047-35588 SESW Sec. 16 TOS R19E Uintah NEWLaikas Federal1-3 43-0473-31178 SWSW, Sec. 3, TilS, R20E Uintah 8Federal 21-6·Ð-19 43447-34813 NENW,Sec. 6 TOSR19E Uintah APDFederal 42-21-*-19 48 047-35406 SENE Sec. 21 TOS RiBE Uintah APDFederal 31-21-9-19 43-047-35006 NWN See. 21 TSS R19E UIntah APOFederal 41-31-9-19 43447-35624 NENE,Sec. 31 TOS RiBE Uintah APDFederal 24-31-0-19 43-047-36623 SESW, Sec. 31, TOS,R19E Uintah NEWWikin Ridge Federal 34-17-10-17 43413-32500 SWSE,Sec. 17, T10S,Ri7E Duchesne APD

O

RECE¡ygp
APÑ3g440/V

OROIL•GAsa
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Uni d States Department of the nterior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT TAKE Pmot*
Utah State Office IN MERICA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3106
(UT-924)

May 18, 2004

Memorandum

To: Vernal Field Office, Moab Field Office

From: Chief, Branch of Minerals Adjudication

Subject: Name Change Approval

Attached is an approved copy of the name change recognized by the Utah State Office. We have
updated our records to reflect the name change from Pannonian Energy Inc., into Gasco
Production Company is effective February 24, 2004.

la/Robert Myn

Robert Lopez
Chief Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. State of Utah Certificate of Registration

cc: MMS, Reference Data Branch, James Sykes, PO Box 25165, Denver CO 80225
State of Utah, DOGM, Attn: Earlene Russell, PO Box 145801, SLC UT 84114 RECElVED
Teyesa Thompson
Jod Incardine ggg 2004
Connie Seare

D\V.OFOIL, GU' °
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PACF 1

'TÎle irst State

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SEÇRETARY OF STATZ OF THE STATE OF

DZLAMARE, DO HESEBY CERTIFY TEE ATTACHEÔIS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDNENT OF "PANNONIAN ENERGY INC.",

CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "PANNONIAN ENERGY INC." TO "GASCO

PRODUCTION COMFANY", FILED IN TEIS OFFICE ON THZ TWENTY-FÚURTH

DAY OF FEBRUARY, A.D. 2004, AT 12:43 O'CLOCK P.N.

A FILED COPY OF THIS CERTIFICATE BAS BZEN FORWARDED TO THE

NEW CASTLE COUNTY RECORDER OF DEED$.

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

2999291 9100 AUTBENTICATION: 2963993

040133641 DATE:
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

Well Name: FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

Api No: 43-047-35343 Lease Type: FEDERAL

Section 30 Township 09S Range 19E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor CRAIG'S ROUSTABOUT SERV RIG # AIR

SPUDDED:
Date 06/02/04

Time 10:00 PM

How ROTARY

Drilling will commence:

Reported by CRAIG OVERMILLER

Telephone# 1-435-828-7151

Date 06/07/2004 Signed
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DivisioN OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: Gasco Production Company Operator Account Number: N 2575

Address: 14 Inverness Drive East, Suite H-236

city Englewood

state CO zip 80112 Phone Number: (303) 483-0044

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

4304735343 Federal 43-30-9-19 NESE 30 9S 19E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity AssignmeÑ
Number Number Effective Date

A 6/6/2004

Comments: r-I rk ITI n iNew well L

Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
4304735404 Federal 11-22-9-19 NWNW 22 9S 19E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

A 6/8/2004

Comments:
New well

Well 3

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments:
New well

RECElVED

ACTION CODES:
pN, OFOIL,GAS&MIN\NG

A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) M Choury
B - Add new well to existingentity(groupor unit well) N'a e ( Me print
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Signature

E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Land Manager 6/15/20 Á
Title Date
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0 0
Gasco Production •

0 0 9
api twsp rng sec well name lease_ num stat la_pa

4304734168 090S 190E 20 FED 24-20-9-19 UTU-75090 DRL

4304734169 090S 190E 20 FED 44-20-9-19 UTU-75090 DRL

4304734199 090S 190E 21 FED 23-21-9-19 UTU-78433 P

4304734608 090S 190E 21 FED 11-21-9-19 UTU-78433 DRL

4304735405 090S 190E 21 FED 42-21-9-19 UTU-78433 APD

4304735606 090S 190E 21 FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 UTU-78433 APD

4304734607 090S 190E 22 LYTHAMFED 22-22-9-19 UTU-78433 P

4304735404 090S 190E 22 FED 11-22-9-19 UTU-78433 DRL

4304733653 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 31-29 UTU-76262 P

4304733750 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 34-29 UTU-76034 P

4304734111 0908 190E 29 FEDERAL 23-29 #1 UTU-76262 P

4304734202 090S 190E 29 FED 42-29-9-19 UTU-76262 P

4304735343 090S 190E 30 FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 UTU-37246 DRL

4304734201 090S 190E 31 FED 32-31-9-19 UTU-76489 P C
4304735623 090S 190E 31 FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 UTU-019880A APD -2"

4304735624 090S 190E 31 FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 UTU-019880A APD 22

4304734286 100S 170E 12 PETES WASH 23-12 #1 UTU-77063 P

4301332560 100S 170E 17 WILKINRIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 UTU-043615 APD

4304734551 100S 170E 24 FED 43-24-3 #1 UTU-74401 P F

4304733983 100S 180E 07 FEDERAL 24-7 #1 UTU-68387 P

4304734539 100S 180E 18 FED 14-18-2 #1 UTU-74971 P

4304735808 100S 180E 22 FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 UTU-018260A APD

4304734924 100S 180E 30 FED 22-30-10-18 UTU-74408 APD

4304734813 100S 190E 06 FED 21-6-10-19 UTU-76490 LA 3/30/2004

4304731178 110S 200E 03 LAFKAS FED 1-3 U-34350 S

4304731818 110S 200E 05 WILLOW CREEK UNIT 2 U-39223 TA

4304731026 110S 200E 10 HILLFEDERAL 1-10 U-44089 TA

0 0
Gasco Production •

0 0 9
api twsp rng sec well name lease_ num stat la_pa

4304734168 090S 190E 20 FED 24-20-9-19 UTU-75090 DRL
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0 11 GA O PRODUCTION COMPÑY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT . LL

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/4/2004 Days: RU1

Depth: 818' GL Prog: 0 OPR: RIG MAINTEN.\NCE Formation: UINTA

DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 1,290 CWC: $ $ 65,934

Contractor: BILLJR'S. Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ -

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim¢ Break Dot m: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 1,290

06:00 06:00 12.00 RIG UP NABORS 611 ON FEDERAL No. 43-30-9-19. Cum. Wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

Cum. Bits: $ -

NOTE: WILL DO RIG MAINTENANCEAND RIG REPAIRS. Rot. Hrs:

12.00

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BKG GAS

CONSULTANT: Bob

0 11 GA O PRODUCTION COMPÑY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT . LL

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/4/2004 Days: RU1

Depth: 818' GL Prog: 0 OPR: RIG MAINTEN.\NCE Formation: UINTA

DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 1,290 CWC: $ $ 65,934

Contractor: BILLJR'S. Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ -

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim¢ Break Dot m: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 1,290

06:00 06:00 12.00 RIG UP NABORS 611 ON FEDERAL No. 43-30-9-19. Cum. Wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

Cum. Bits: $ -

NOTE: WILL DO RIG MAINTENANCEAND RIG REPAIRS. Rot. Hrs:

12.00

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BKG GAS

CONSULTANT: Bob

0 11 GA O PRODUCTION COMPÑY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT . LL

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/4/2004 Days: RU1

Depth: 818' GL Prog: 0 OPR: RIG MAINTEN.\NCE Formation: UINTA

DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 1,290 CWC: $ $ 65,934

Contractor: BILLJR'S. Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ -

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim¢ Break Dot m: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 1,290

06:00 06:00 12.00 RIG UP NABORS 611 ON FEDERAL No. 43-30-9-19. Cum. Wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

Cum. Bits: $ -

NOTE: WILL DO RIG MAINTENANCEAND RIG REPAIRS. Rot. Hrs:

12.00

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BKG GAS

CONSULTANT: Bob



ofs //m se GA O PRODUCTION COMPA
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/5/2004 Days: Oa

Depth 818' Prog: OPR: RIG MAINTEN\NCE Formation: UNITA

DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 14,048 Cwc: $ $ 79,982

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ 3,288

PVlYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ -

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ 1,691 Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 6,609

Sand: Dev: Out: Packem: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: Separator; $ - Corrosion: $ -

PffMf: FPH: Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT; $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,170

Time Break Dot'n: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 12,357

06:00 06:00 12:00 RIG UP AND PERFORM RIG MAINTENANCEAND RIG REPAIRS. cum.wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

Cum. Bits: $ -

Rot. Hrs:

12:00

TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: BKGGAS
CONSULTANT: BOB

ofs //m se GA O PRODUCTION COMPA
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/5/2004 Days: Oa

Depth 818' Prog: OPR: RIG MAINTEN\NCE Formation: UNITA

DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 14,048 Cwc: $ $ 79,982

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ 3,288

PVlYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ -

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ 1,691 Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 6,609

Sand: Dev: Out: Packem: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: Separator; $ - Corrosion: $ -

PffMf: FPH: Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT; $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,170

Time Break Dot'n: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 12,357

06:00 06:00 12:00 RIG UP AND PERFORM RIG MAINTENANCEAND RIG REPAIRS. cum.wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

Cum. Bits: $ -

Rot. Hrs:

12:00

TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: BKGGAS
CONSULTANT: BOB

ofs //m se GA O PRODUCTION COMPA
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/5/2004 Days: Oa

Depth 818' Prog: OPR: RIG MAINTEN\NCE Formation: UNITA

DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 14,048 Cwc: $ $ 79,982

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ 3,288

PVlYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ -

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ 1,691 Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 6,609

Sand: Dev: Out: Packem: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: Separator; $ - Corrosion: $ -

PffMf: FPH: Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT; $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,170

Time Break Dot'n: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 12,357

06:00 06:00 12:00 RIG UP AND PERFORM RIG MAINTENANCEAND RIG REPAIRS. cum.wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

Cum. Bits: $ -

Rot. Hrs:

12:00

TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: BKGGAS
CONSULTANT: BOB



0 1
o GA O PRODUCTION COMP

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/6/2004 Days: Ob
Depth: 818" Prog: 0 OPR: RIG MAINTEN.\NCE Formation: UNITA

DMC: $ 0 TMC $ 0 TDC: $ $ 74,545 Cwc: $ $ 154,527

Contractor: NABORS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ 63,780

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ -

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 8,088

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf; FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,387

Timt Break Down: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 74,545

06:00 06:00 12:00 RIG UP AND PERFORM RIG MAINTENANCEAND RIG REPAIRS. Cum. wtr; $ 8,088

Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

Cum. Bits: $ -

Rot. Hrs:

TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: BKGGAS
CONSULTANT: BOB

0 1
o GA O PRODUCTION COMP

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/6/2004 Days: Ob
Depth: 818" Prog: 0 OPR: RIG MAINTEN.\NCE Formation: UNITA

DMC: $ 0 TMC $ 0 TDC: $ $ 74,545 Cwc: $ $ 154,527

Contractor: NABORS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ 63,780

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ -

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 8,088

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf; FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,387

Timt Break Down: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 74,545

06:00 06:00 12:00 RIG UP AND PERFORM RIG MAINTENANCEAND RIG REPAIRS. Cum. wtr; $ 8,088

Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

Cum. Bits: $ -

Rot. Hrs:

TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: BKGGAS
CONSULTANT: BOB

0 1
o GA O PRODUCTION COMP

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/6/2004 Days: Ob
Depth: 818" Prog: 0 OPR: RIG MAINTEN.\NCE Formation: UNITA

DMC: $ 0 TMC $ 0 TDC: $ $ 74,545 Cwc: $ $ 154,527

Contractor: NABORS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ 63,780

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ -

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 8,088

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf; FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,387

Timt Break Down: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 74,545

06:00 06:00 12:00 RIG UP AND PERFORM RIG MAINTENANCEAND RIG REPAIRS. Cum. wtr; $ 8,088

Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

Cum. Bits: $ -

Rot. Hrs:

TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: BKGGAS
CONSULTANT: BOB



Tes do s-o GA O PRODUCTION COMPA
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/8/2004 Days: Od

Depth: 818' Prog: 0 OPR: CALIPER & STR,\P BHA. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 10,970 CWC: $ $ 169,082

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: l\1 I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.34 Liner: Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Rig Move:

VIS: 27 Stroke: SIN: 10421265 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 9,180

Gel: Press: MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: 3 - 22 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: 818 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 540

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: Heater: ' $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor; $ 400

Tims Break DO\ m: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 10,970

06:00 12:00 6.00 PINNED BOARD TO DERRICK. PREPARE TO RAISE DERRICK. Cum. wtr: $ 8,088

12:00 18:00 6.00 RAISE DERRICK. RIG UP DRILL FLOOR. PREPARE MUDTANKS. Cum. Fuel S 6,609

18:00 22:00 4.00 CHANGE OUT ROTARY TABLE LOCK PINS. WELDER BUILTUP cum.Bits: $ -

ALL LOCKINGHOUSING SLOTS. Rot. Hrs:

22:00 03:00 5.00 PUT ROTARY TABLE BACK TOGETHER. HADTROUBLE HOOKING UP ROTARY CHAIN.

03:00 06:00 3.00 FINISH RIGGING UP DRILL FLOOR. PICK UP AND MAKEUP KELLYASSEMBLY.

24.00

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BKG GAS

CONSULTANT: BOB

Tes do s-o GA O PRODUCTION COMPA
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/8/2004 Days: Od

Depth: 818' Prog: 0 OPR: CALIPER & STR,\P BHA. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 10,970 CWC: $ $ 169,082

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: l\1 I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.34 Liner: Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Rig Move:

VIS: 27 Stroke: SIN: 10421265 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 9,180

Gel: Press: MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: 3 - 22 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: 818 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 540

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: Heater: ' $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor; $ 400

Tims Break DO\ m: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 10,970

06:00 12:00 6.00 PINNED BOARD TO DERRICK. PREPARE TO RAISE DERRICK. Cum. wtr: $ 8,088

12:00 18:00 6.00 RAISE DERRICK. RIG UP DRILL FLOOR. PREPARE MUDTANKS. Cum. Fuel S 6,609

18:00 22:00 4.00 CHANGE OUT ROTARY TABLE LOCK PINS. WELDER BUILTUP cum.Bits: $ -

ALL LOCKINGHOUSING SLOTS. Rot. Hrs:

22:00 03:00 5.00 PUT ROTARY TABLE BACK TOGETHER. HADTROUBLE HOOKING UP ROTARY CHAIN.

03:00 06:00 3.00 FINISH RIGGING UP DRILL FLOOR. PICK UP AND MAKEUP KELLYASSEMBLY.

24.00

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BKG GAS

CONSULTANT: BOB

Tes do s-o GA O PRODUCTION COMPA
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/8/2004 Days: Od

Depth: 818' Prog: 0 OPR: CALIPER & STR,\P BHA. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 10,970 CWC: $ $ 169,082

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: l\1 I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.34 Liner: Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Rig Move:

VIS: 27 Stroke: SIN: 10421265 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 9,180

Gel: Press: MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: 3 - 22 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: 818 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 540

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: Heater: ' $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor; $ 400

Tims Break DO\ m: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 10,970

06:00 12:00 6.00 PINNED BOARD TO DERRICK. PREPARE TO RAISE DERRICK. Cum. wtr: $ 8,088

12:00 18:00 6.00 RAISE DERRICK. RIG UP DRILL FLOOR. PREPARE MUDTANKS. Cum. Fuel S 6,609

18:00 22:00 4.00 CHANGE OUT ROTARY TABLE LOCK PINS. WELDER BUILTUP cum.Bits: $ -

ALL LOCKINGHOUSING SLOTS. Rot. Hrs:

22:00 03:00 5.00 PUT ROTARY TABLE BACK TOGETHER. HADTROUBLE HOOKING UP ROTARY CHAIN.

03:00 06:00 3.00 FINISH RIGGING UP DRILL FLOOR. PICK UP AND MAKEUP KELLYASSEMBLY.

24.00

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BKG GAS

CONSULTANT: BOB



0 14 GA O PRODUCTION COMPA
/ DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/7/2004 Days: Oc

Depth: Prog: OPR: RIG UP. Formation:

DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 3,585 CWC: $ $ 158,112

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #; Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg; $ - Rig Cost:

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,295

Time Break Doun: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 3,585

06:00 18:00 12.00 RIG UP AND PERFORM RIG MAINTENANCEAND REPAIRS. cum.wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

WINTERIZINGOF DERRICK BOARD COMPLETE. Cum. Bits: $ -

MUDTANK MODIFICATIONCOMPLETE. Rot. Hrs:

WILL RAISE DERRICK SATURDAYMORNING.

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BKG GAS

CONSULTANT: BOB

0 14 GA O PRODUCTION COMPA
/ DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/7/2004 Days: Oc

Depth: Prog: OPR: RIG UP. Formation:

DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 3,585 CWC: $ $ 158,112

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #; Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg; $ - Rig Cost:

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,295

Time Break Doun: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 3,585

06:00 18:00 12.00 RIG UP AND PERFORM RIG MAINTENANCEAND REPAIRS. cum.wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

WINTERIZINGOF DERRICK BOARD COMPLETE. Cum. Bits: $ -

MUDTANK MODIFICATIONCOMPLETE. Rot. Hrs:

WILL RAISE DERRICK SATURDAYMORNING.

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BKG GAS

CONSULTANT: BOB

0 14 GA O PRODUCTION COMPA
/ DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/7/2004 Days: Oc

Depth: Prog: OPR: RIG UP. Formation:

DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 0 TDC: $ $ 3,585 CWC: $ $ 158,112

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: Bit #; Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg; $ - Rig Cost:

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 440

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,295

Time Break Doun: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 3,585

06:00 18:00 12.00 RIG UP AND PERFORM RIG MAINTENANCEAND REPAIRS. cum.wtr: $ -

Cum. Fuel $ -

WINTERIZINGOF DERRICK BOARD COMPLETE. Cum. Bits: $ -

MUDTANK MODIFICATIONCOMPLETE. Rot. Hrs:

WILL RAISE DERRICK SATURDAYMORNING.

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BKG GAS

CONSULTANT: BOB



·¯/"D'Is if/fE S-a, G O PRODUCTION COMPÊY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/9/2004 Days: 1

Depth: 1,472' Prog: 654' OPR: MOTOR DRILL 12- /4" HOLE. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 2268 TMC: $ 2268 TDC: $ $ 30,464 CWC: $ $ 199,546

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: Ill I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.6 Liner: 6 Bit #; 1 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 190 Size: 12-1/4" Int, csg: $ - Rig cost; $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,100 MFG: SECURITY Prod cog: $ - BHA: $ 1,495

ph: 7.5 GPM: 610 Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 175 Jets: 3 - 22 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 115/135 In: 818 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

sand: Dev: 1-1/4 Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits i Corehead: $ 12,000

Solids: FTG: 654 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 16000 Hrs: 11.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 0.0/1.6 FPH: 56.9 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,268

Ca: 400 WOB: 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc.I Labor: $ 2,146

Tirm Break Dos m: RPM: 65 - 80 Misc: $ - Transporation: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 62,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 30,464

06:00 08:30 2.50 HELD PRE-SPUD MEETING. STRAP & CALIPER BHA. cum.wtr: $ 8,088

08:30 11:30 3.00 PICK UP BIT, MUD MOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, XO, 1 - 6-3/8" DC. Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

11:30 12:30 1.00 CHANGE MOTOR ON KELLYSPINNER. cum.Bits: $ 12,000

12:30 15:30 3.00 PICK UP 20 - 6-3/8" DC'S. RIH TO 774 FT RKB. Rot. Hrs: 11.5

15:30 16:30 1.00 REPAIR LEAKON KELLY HOSE CONNECTION.

16:30 17:30 1.00 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 774 FT = 1 DEGREE.

17:30 02:30 9.00 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 818 TO 1,295 FT. 477 FT AT 53.0 FPH.

02:30 03:30 1.00 PUMP SWEEP. WlRELINE SURVEY AT 1,221 FT = 1-1/4 DEGREE.

03:30 06:00 2.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 1,295 TO 1,472 FT. 177 FT AT 70.8 FPH.

NOTE SPUD 12-1/4" HOLE AT 05:30 PM SUNDAY 08 AUGUST 2004.

SPR: No 1 = 200 PSIG AT 72 SPM. No. 2 = 200 PSIG AT 74 SPM.

24.00

UP = 80,000 LBS. DOWN = 75,000 LBS. ROTATING = 78,000 LBS. TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BIT, MUDMOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, X-O, 21 - 6-3/8" DC'S. TOTAL LENGTH = 774.00 FT. BKGGAS

CONSULTANT: BOB

·¯/"D'Is if/fE S-a, G O PRODUCTION COMPÊY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/9/2004 Days: 1

Depth: 1,472' Prog: 654' OPR: MOTOR DRILL 12- /4" HOLE. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 2268 TMC: $ 2268 TDC: $ $ 30,464 CWC: $ $ 199,546

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: Ill I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.6 Liner: 6 Bit #; 1 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 190 Size: 12-1/4" Int, csg: $ - Rig cost; $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,100 MFG: SECURITY Prod cog: $ - BHA: $ 1,495

ph: 7.5 GPM: 610 Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 175 Jets: 3 - 22 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 115/135 In: 818 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

sand: Dev: 1-1/4 Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits i Corehead: $ 12,000

Solids: FTG: 654 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 16000 Hrs: 11.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 0.0/1.6 FPH: 56.9 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,268

Ca: 400 WOB: 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc.I Labor: $ 2,146

Tirm Break Dos m: RPM: 65 - 80 Misc: $ - Transporation: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 62,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 30,464

06:00 08:30 2.50 HELD PRE-SPUD MEETING. STRAP & CALIPER BHA. cum.wtr: $ 8,088

08:30 11:30 3.00 PICK UP BIT, MUD MOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, XO, 1 - 6-3/8" DC. Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

11:30 12:30 1.00 CHANGE MOTOR ON KELLYSPINNER. cum.Bits: $ 12,000

12:30 15:30 3.00 PICK UP 20 - 6-3/8" DC'S. RIH TO 774 FT RKB. Rot. Hrs: 11.5

15:30 16:30 1.00 REPAIR LEAKON KELLY HOSE CONNECTION.

16:30 17:30 1.00 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 774 FT = 1 DEGREE.

17:30 02:30 9.00 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 818 TO 1,295 FT. 477 FT AT 53.0 FPH.

02:30 03:30 1.00 PUMP SWEEP. WlRELINE SURVEY AT 1,221 FT = 1-1/4 DEGREE.

03:30 06:00 2.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 1,295 TO 1,472 FT. 177 FT AT 70.8 FPH.

NOTE SPUD 12-1/4" HOLE AT 05:30 PM SUNDAY 08 AUGUST 2004.

SPR: No 1 = 200 PSIG AT 72 SPM. No. 2 = 200 PSIG AT 74 SPM.

24.00

UP = 80,000 LBS. DOWN = 75,000 LBS. ROTATING = 78,000 LBS. TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BIT, MUDMOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, X-O, 21 - 6-3/8" DC'S. TOTAL LENGTH = 774.00 FT. BKGGAS

CONSULTANT: BOB

·¯/"D'Is if/fE S-a, G O PRODUCTION COMPÊY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/9/2004 Days: 1

Depth: 1,472' Prog: 654' OPR: MOTOR DRILL 12- /4" HOLE. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 2268 TMC: $ 2268 TDC: $ $ 30,464 CWC: $ $ 199,546

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: Ill I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.6 Liner: 6 Bit #; 1 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 190 Size: 12-1/4" Int, csg: $ - Rig cost; $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,100 MFG: SECURITY Prod cog: $ - BHA: $ 1,495

ph: 7.5 GPM: 610 Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 175 Jets: 3 - 22 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 115/135 In: 818 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

sand: Dev: 1-1/4 Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits i Corehead: $ 12,000

Solids: FTG: 654 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 16000 Hrs: 11.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 0.0/1.6 FPH: 56.9 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,268

Ca: 400 WOB: 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc.I Labor: $ 2,146

Tirm Break Dos m: RPM: 65 - 80 Misc: $ - Transporation: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 62,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 30,464

06:00 08:30 2.50 HELD PRE-SPUD MEETING. STRAP & CALIPER BHA. cum.wtr: $ 8,088

08:30 11:30 3.00 PICK UP BIT, MUD MOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, XO, 1 - 6-3/8" DC. Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

11:30 12:30 1.00 CHANGE MOTOR ON KELLYSPINNER. cum.Bits: $ 12,000

12:30 15:30 3.00 PICK UP 20 - 6-3/8" DC'S. RIH TO 774 FT RKB. Rot. Hrs: 11.5

15:30 16:30 1.00 REPAIR LEAKON KELLY HOSE CONNECTION.

16:30 17:30 1.00 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 774 FT = 1 DEGREE.

17:30 02:30 9.00 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 818 TO 1,295 FT. 477 FT AT 53.0 FPH.

02:30 03:30 1.00 PUMP SWEEP. WlRELINE SURVEY AT 1,221 FT = 1-1/4 DEGREE.

03:30 06:00 2.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 1,295 TO 1,472 FT. 177 FT AT 70.8 FPH.

NOTE SPUD 12-1/4" HOLE AT 05:30 PM SUNDAY 08 AUGUST 2004.

SPR: No 1 = 200 PSIG AT 72 SPM. No. 2 = 200 PSIG AT 74 SPM.

24.00

UP = 80,000 LBS. DOWN = 75,000 LBS. ROTATING = 78,000 LBS. TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BIT, MUDMOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, X-O, 21 - 6-3/8" DC'S. TOTAL LENGTH = 774.00 FT. BKGGAS

CONSULTANT: BOB



oys 4/755 GA O PRODUCTION COMP
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT LL ,

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/10/2004 Days: 2

Depth: 2,412' Prog: 940' OPR: PULL OUT OF lOLE. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 2,146 TMC: $ 4,414 TDC: $ $ 17,236 CWC: $ $ 216,782

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 1 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. cag: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 190 Size: 12-1/4" Int. csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,250 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg; $ - BHA: $ 2,535

ph: 9 GPM: 610 Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 175 Jets: 3 - 22 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 115/135 In: 818 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: 1,594 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 31.0 separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

Pf/Mf: 1.3/3.8 FPH: 51.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,146

Ca: 120 WOB: 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 65 - 80 Misc: $ - $ -

START END TIME BHA: 62,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,236

06:00 13:00 7.00 MOTOR DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE FROM 1,472 TO 1,806 FT. Cum. Wtr: $ 8,088

334 FT AT 47.7 FPH. Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

13:00 13:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 1,733 FT = 1 DEGREE. Cum. Bits: $ 12,000

13:30 18:00 4.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 1,806 TO 2,029 FT. cumRot: 31.0

223 FT AT 49.6 FPH.

18:00 00:00 6.00 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,029 TO 2,316 FT. 287 FT AT 47.8 FPH.

00:00 00:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 2,243 FT = MIS-RUN.

00:30 1:00 0.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,316 TO 2,348 FT. 32 FT AT 64.0 FPH.

01:00 01:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 2,275 FT = MIS-RUN. 7 DEGREE CLOCK.

01:30 02:00 0.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,348 TO 2,380 FT. 32 FT AT 64,0 FPH.

02:00 02:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 2,307 FT = 12 DEGREES. USED 14 DEGREE CLOCK.

02:30 03:30 1.00 MOTOR DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,380 TO 2,412 FT. 32 FT AT 32.0 FPH.

03:30 04:00 0.50 CIRCULATEAND PUMP VISCOUS SWEEP.

04:00 06:00 2.00 PULL OUT OF HOLE. CHECK SHOT SURVEYS WITH 14 DEGREE CLOCK

AT 1,669 FT = 6 DEGREES. AT 11,92 FT = 1-3/4 DEGREE.

SPR No.1 = 200 PSIG AT 72 SPM. No. 2 = 290 PSIG AT 74 SPM.
24.00

UP = 105,000 LBS. DOWN = 90,000 LBS. ROTATING = 98,000 LBS. TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BIT, MUD MOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, X-O, 21 - 6-3/8" DC'S. TOTAL LENGTH = 774.00 FT. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB

oys 4/755 GA O PRODUCTION COMP
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT LL ,

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/10/2004 Days: 2

Depth: 2,412' Prog: 940' OPR: PULL OUT OF lOLE. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 2,146 TMC: $ 4,414 TDC: $ $ 17,236 CWC: $ $ 216,782

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 1 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. cag: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 190 Size: 12-1/4" Int. csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,250 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg; $ - BHA: $ 2,535

ph: 9 GPM: 610 Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 175 Jets: 3 - 22 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 115/135 In: 818 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: 1,594 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 31.0 separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

Pf/Mf: 1.3/3.8 FPH: 51.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,146

Ca: 120 WOB: 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 65 - 80 Misc: $ - $ -

START END TIME BHA: 62,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,236

06:00 13:00 7.00 MOTOR DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE FROM 1,472 TO 1,806 FT. Cum. Wtr: $ 8,088

334 FT AT 47.7 FPH. Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

13:00 13:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 1,733 FT = 1 DEGREE. Cum. Bits: $ 12,000

13:30 18:00 4.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 1,806 TO 2,029 FT. cumRot: 31.0

223 FT AT 49.6 FPH.

18:00 00:00 6.00 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,029 TO 2,316 FT. 287 FT AT 47.8 FPH.

00:00 00:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 2,243 FT = MIS-RUN.

00:30 1:00 0.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,316 TO 2,348 FT. 32 FT AT 64.0 FPH.

01:00 01:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 2,275 FT = MIS-RUN. 7 DEGREE CLOCK.

01:30 02:00 0.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,348 TO 2,380 FT. 32 FT AT 64,0 FPH.

02:00 02:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 2,307 FT = 12 DEGREES. USED 14 DEGREE CLOCK.

02:30 03:30 1.00 MOTOR DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,380 TO 2,412 FT. 32 FT AT 32.0 FPH.

03:30 04:00 0.50 CIRCULATEAND PUMP VISCOUS SWEEP.

04:00 06:00 2.00 PULL OUT OF HOLE. CHECK SHOT SURVEYS WITH 14 DEGREE CLOCK

AT 1,669 FT = 6 DEGREES. AT 11,92 FT = 1-3/4 DEGREE.

SPR No.1 = 200 PSIG AT 72 SPM. No. 2 = 290 PSIG AT 74 SPM.
24.00

UP = 105,000 LBS. DOWN = 90,000 LBS. ROTATING = 98,000 LBS. TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BIT, MUD MOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, X-O, 21 - 6-3/8" DC'S. TOTAL LENGTH = 774.00 FT. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB

oys 4/755 GA O PRODUCTION COMP
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT LL ,

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/10/2004 Days: 2

Depth: 2,412' Prog: 940' OPR: PULL OUT OF lOLE. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 2,146 TMC: $ 4,414 TDC: $ $ 17,236 CWC: $ $ 216,782

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 1 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. cag: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 190 Size: 12-1/4" Int. csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,250 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg; $ - BHA: $ 2,535

ph: 9 GPM: 610 Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 175 Jets: 3 - 22 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 115/135 In: 818 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: 1,594 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 31.0 separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

Pf/Mf: 1.3/3.8 FPH: 51.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,146

Ca: 120 WOB: 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 65 - 80 Misc: $ - $ -

START END TIME BHA: 62,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,236

06:00 13:00 7.00 MOTOR DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE FROM 1,472 TO 1,806 FT. Cum. Wtr: $ 8,088

334 FT AT 47.7 FPH. Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

13:00 13:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 1,733 FT = 1 DEGREE. Cum. Bits: $ 12,000

13:30 18:00 4.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 1,806 TO 2,029 FT. cumRot: 31.0

223 FT AT 49.6 FPH.

18:00 00:00 6.00 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,029 TO 2,316 FT. 287 FT AT 47.8 FPH.

00:00 00:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 2,243 FT = MIS-RUN.

00:30 1:00 0.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,316 TO 2,348 FT. 32 FT AT 64.0 FPH.

01:00 01:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 2,275 FT = MIS-RUN. 7 DEGREE CLOCK.

01:30 02:00 0.50 MOTOR DRILL12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,348 TO 2,380 FT. 32 FT AT 64,0 FPH.

02:00 02:30 0.50 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 2,307 FT = 12 DEGREES. USED 14 DEGREE CLOCK.

02:30 03:30 1.00 MOTOR DRILL 12-1/4" HOLE FROM 2,380 TO 2,412 FT. 32 FT AT 32.0 FPH.

03:30 04:00 0.50 CIRCULATEAND PUMP VISCOUS SWEEP.

04:00 06:00 2.00 PULL OUT OF HOLE. CHECK SHOT SURVEYS WITH 14 DEGREE CLOCK

AT 1,669 FT = 6 DEGREES. AT 11,92 FT = 1-3/4 DEGREE.

SPR No.1 = 200 PSIG AT 72 SPM. No. 2 = 290 PSIG AT 74 SPM.
24.00

UP = 105,000 LBS. DOWN = 90,000 LBS. ROTATING = 98,000 LBS. TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BIT, MUD MOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, X-O, 21 - 6-3/8" DC'S. TOTAL LENGTH = 774.00 FT. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB



J'oß /Ý/fE so GA O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/11/2004 Days: 3

Depth: 2,412' Prog: 0 OPR: POOH WITH DRI .L PIPE. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 1,123 TMC: $ 5,537 TDC: $ $ 22,272 CWC: $ $ 239,054

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: Ill I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: Size: 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 175 Jets: 3 - 22 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 115/135 In: 818 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 2,700

Sand: Dev: Out: 2412 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: 1,594 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 16,000 Hrs: 31.0 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.3/3.7 FPH: 51.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: 1 - 1 - I Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,123

Ca: 120 WOB: 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,153

Tims Break Doun: RPM: 65 - 80 Misc: $ - Logging: S 4,741

START END TIME BHA: 62,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 22,272

06:00 09:00 3.00 PULL OUT OF HOLE. Cum. wtr: $ 10,788

09:00 10:00 1.00 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

10:00 13:00 3.00 WAIT ON SCHLUMBERGER DIRECTIONALSURVEY TOOL. Cum. Bits: $ 12,000

13:00 14:00 1.00 HELD PRE-JOB AND SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP cumRot: 31.0

SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS.

14:00 16:00 2.00 RUN SCHLUMBERGER DIRECTIONALSURVEY LOG. LOGGERS TD = 2,414 FT.

16:00 16:30 0.50 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS.

16:30 20:30 4.00 RUN IN HOLE OPENED DRILL PIPE. PICK UP SINGLES TO REPLACE BHA.

20:30 21:00 0.50 PUMP VISCOUS SWEEP.
21:00 03:00 6.00 MIXAND SPOT 200 BBLS 80 VIS PILL FROM 2412 TO 1,400 FT.
03:00 03:30 0.50 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO 1,430 FT.
03:30 04:00 0.50 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN. PUMPED 4 BBLS VISCOUS PILLTO RESERVE PIT.

04:00 06:00 2.00 HELD PRE-JOB AND SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP DOWELL CEMENTERS. PRESSURE

TEST CEMENT LINETO 1,350 PSIG. MIXAND PUMP OPEN HOLE BALANCEDPLUG.

SPOTTED 340 SKS CLASS G + 10.0% SILICA FLOUR + 1.0% DISPERANT + 0.5% CACL2 +

AT 17.5 PPG. YlELD = 1.09 CUFT/SK. WATER = 4.6 GALS/SK. PLUG SET FROM 1,430

TO 1,100 FT.
24.00

UP = 105,000 LBS. DOWN = 90,000 LBS. ROTATING = 98,000 LBS. TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BIT, MUD MOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, X-O, 21 - 6-3/8" DC'S. TOTAL LENGTH = 774.00 FT. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB

J'oß /Ý/fE so GA O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/11/2004 Days: 3

Depth: 2,412' Prog: 0 OPR: POOH WITH DRI .L PIPE. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 1,123 TMC: $ 5,537 TDC: $ $ 22,272 CWC: $ $ 239,054

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: Ill I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: Size: 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 175 Jets: 3 - 22 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 115/135 In: 818 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 2,700

Sand: Dev: Out: 2412 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: 1,594 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 16,000 Hrs: 31.0 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.3/3.7 FPH: 51.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: 1 - 1 - I Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,123

Ca: 120 WOB: 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,153

Tims Break Doun: RPM: 65 - 80 Misc: $ - Logging: S 4,741

START END TIME BHA: 62,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 22,272

06:00 09:00 3.00 PULL OUT OF HOLE. Cum. wtr: $ 10,788

09:00 10:00 1.00 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

10:00 13:00 3.00 WAIT ON SCHLUMBERGER DIRECTIONALSURVEY TOOL. Cum. Bits: $ 12,000

13:00 14:00 1.00 HELD PRE-JOB AND SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP cumRot: 31.0

SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS.

14:00 16:00 2.00 RUN SCHLUMBERGER DIRECTIONALSURVEY LOG. LOGGERS TD = 2,414 FT.

16:00 16:30 0.50 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS.

16:30 20:30 4.00 RUN IN HOLE OPENED DRILL PIPE. PICK UP SINGLES TO REPLACE BHA.

20:30 21:00 0.50 PUMP VISCOUS SWEEP.
21:00 03:00 6.00 MIXAND SPOT 200 BBLS 80 VIS PILL FROM 2412 TO 1,400 FT.
03:00 03:30 0.50 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO 1,430 FT.
03:30 04:00 0.50 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN. PUMPED 4 BBLS VISCOUS PILLTO RESERVE PIT.

04:00 06:00 2.00 HELD PRE-JOB AND SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP DOWELL CEMENTERS. PRESSURE

TEST CEMENT LINETO 1,350 PSIG. MIXAND PUMP OPEN HOLE BALANCEDPLUG.

SPOTTED 340 SKS CLASS G + 10.0% SILICA FLOUR + 1.0% DISPERANT + 0.5% CACL2 +

AT 17.5 PPG. YlELD = 1.09 CUFT/SK. WATER = 4.6 GALS/SK. PLUG SET FROM 1,430

TO 1,100 FT.
24.00

UP = 105,000 LBS. DOWN = 90,000 LBS. ROTATING = 98,000 LBS. TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BIT, MUD MOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, X-O, 21 - 6-3/8" DC'S. TOTAL LENGTH = 774.00 FT. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB

J'oß /Ý/fE so GA O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/11/2004 Days: 3

Depth: 2,412' Prog: 0 OPR: POOH WITH DRI .L PIPE. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 1,123 TMC: $ 5,537 TDC: $ $ 22,272 CWC: $ $ 239,054

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: Ill I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 1 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: Size: 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 175 Jets: 3 - 22 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 115/135 In: 818 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 2,700

Sand: Dev: Out: 2412 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: 1,594 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 16,000 Hrs: 31.0 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.3/3.7 FPH: 51.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: 1 - 1 - I Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,123

Ca: 120 WOB: 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,153

Tims Break Doun: RPM: 65 - 80 Misc: $ - Logging: S 4,741

START END TIME BHA: 62,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 22,272

06:00 09:00 3.00 PULL OUT OF HOLE. Cum. wtr: $ 10,788

09:00 10:00 1.00 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Fuel $ 6,609

10:00 13:00 3.00 WAIT ON SCHLUMBERGER DIRECTIONALSURVEY TOOL. Cum. Bits: $ 12,000

13:00 14:00 1.00 HELD PRE-JOB AND SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP cumRot: 31.0

SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS.

14:00 16:00 2.00 RUN SCHLUMBERGER DIRECTIONALSURVEY LOG. LOGGERS TD = 2,414 FT.

16:00 16:30 0.50 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER LOGGERS.

16:30 20:30 4.00 RUN IN HOLE OPENED DRILL PIPE. PICK UP SINGLES TO REPLACE BHA.

20:30 21:00 0.50 PUMP VISCOUS SWEEP.
21:00 03:00 6.00 MIXAND SPOT 200 BBLS 80 VIS PILL FROM 2412 TO 1,400 FT.
03:00 03:30 0.50 PULL OUT OF HOLE TO 1,430 FT.
03:30 04:00 0.50 CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN. PUMPED 4 BBLS VISCOUS PILLTO RESERVE PIT.

04:00 06:00 2.00 HELD PRE-JOB AND SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP DOWELL CEMENTERS. PRESSURE

TEST CEMENT LINETO 1,350 PSIG. MIXAND PUMP OPEN HOLE BALANCEDPLUG.

SPOTTED 340 SKS CLASS G + 10.0% SILICA FLOUR + 1.0% DISPERANT + 0.5% CACL2 +

AT 17.5 PPG. YlELD = 1.09 CUFT/SK. WATER = 4.6 GALS/SK. PLUG SET FROM 1,430

TO 1,100 FT.
24.00

UP = 105,000 LBS. DOWN = 90,000 LBS. ROTATING = 98,000 LBS. TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: BIT, MUD MOTOR, 3 - 8" DC'S, X-O, 21 - 6-3/8" DC'S. TOTAL LENGTH = 774.00 FT. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB
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ggygg s_,,, GASC RODUCTION COMPAN

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT i ss

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/12/2004 Days: 4

Depth: 1100' PB Prog: 0 OPR: PICK UP SIDETRI.CK BHA. Formation: UNITA
DMc: $ 1,871 TMC: $ 7,408 TDC: $ $ 30,728 CWC: $ $ 269,782

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 1 RR Conductor; $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: Size: 12-1/4" Int. cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ 14,141

WL: nc NV: Jets: 3 - 18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks; $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chls: 16,000 Hrs: Separator; $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.5/4.4 FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,871

ca: 120 WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,161

Timt Break Doun: RPM: Misc: $ - Anadrill: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 30,728

06:00 06:30 0.50 RIG DOWN DOWELL CEMENTERS. 25% RETURNS LAST cum. wtr: 5 10,788

3 BBLS OF DISPLACEMENT. cum.Fuel $ 6,609

06:30 07:00 0.50 PULL OUT OF HOLE 8 STANDS DRILLPIPE. cum.Bits: $ 12,000

07:00 08:00 1.00 LAYDOWN 21 JOINTS DRILLPIPE. Cum Rot: 31.0

08:00 02:00 18.00 WAIT ON CEMENT. MONITOR HOLE. HOLE SEEPED 8 BBLS. HOLE STATIC AT 24:00 HRS.

02:00 06:00 4.00 PICK UP SIDETRACK ASSEMBLY. ORIENTATE MUDMOTOR AND MWD.

24.00

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: Bit, MM (1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =
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s flyg 5 ao GAO PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORTD-o ¥Ms's 9 0 1 6

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/12/2004 Days: S

Depth: 1447' PB Prog: 0 OPR: WAIT ON CElliENT Formation: UNITA

DMC: $ 0 TMC: $ 7,408 TDC: $ $ 24,355 Cwc: $ $ 294,137

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 1 RR conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 Surf. cog: $ - Location: $ -

Pv/YP: 1/1 SPM: Size: 12-1/4" int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NY: Jets: 3 - 18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGlRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 16,000 Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.5/4.4 FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: 120 WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dos m: RPM: Misc: $ - Dir Driller: $ 11,800

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 24,355

06:00 09:30. 3.50 RUN IN HOLE TO 450 FT. TEST MWD AND MUD MOTOR. cum. wtr: $ 10,788

09:30 11:30 2.00 RUN IN HOLE TO 1,125 FT. CIRCULATE. NO CEMENT. cum.Fuel $ 6,609

11:30 13:30 2.00 RUN IN HOLE TO 1,316 FT. KELLYUP. WASH TO 1,364 FT. Cum. Bits: $ 12,000

CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP. CEMENT COLORED WATER. cumRot: 31.0

13:30 16:30 3.00 RUN IN HOLE TO 1,412 FT. KELLYUP. LOWER TO 1,442 FT. TOOK 10,000 LBS WEIGHT.

CIRCULATE. DRILL5 FT WITH 5-7 M. 240 FPH. CBU. RECOVERED PASTE LIKECEMENT.

16:30 19:30 3.00 PULL OUT OF HOLE. LAYDOWN MWD PROBE.

19:30 01:00 5.50 RUN IN HOLE OPEN-ENDED DRILL PIPE TO 1,447 FT. PUMP VISCOUS LCM SWEEP.

NO LOSSES OR CUTTINGS. WAIT ON DOWELL CEMENTERS. ARRIVED 23:30 HRS.

01:00 02:00 1.00 HELD PRE-JOB AND SAFETY MEETING. RIG UP DOWELL CEMENTERS.

02:00 02:30 0.50 TEST LINETO 1,000 PSIG. MIXAND PUMP 190 SKS CLASS G (10-2 RFC) + 0.125 LBS/SK

POLYESTER FLAKES + 2% CACL2 + 10% GYPSUM AT 14.2 PPG. YIELD = 1.61 CUFTISK.

WATER = 7.9 GALS/SK. SET AS BALANCEDPLUG. FULLRETURNS DURING JOB.

02:30 03:30 0.50 PULL OUT OF HOLE 3 STANDS TO 11,190 FT.

03:00 04:30 1.50 CIRCULATE 1-1/2 TIMES BOTTOMS UP. CIRCULATED48 SKS CEMENT TO RESERVE PIT.

04:30 06:00 1.50 WAIT ON CEMENT.

24.00

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: Bit, MM(1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
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02:30 03:30 0.50 PULL OUT OF HOLE 3 STANDS TO 11,190 FT.

03:00 04:30 1.50 CIRCULATE 1-1/2 TIMES BOTTOMS UP. CIRCULATED48 SKS CEMENT TO RESERVE PIT.

04:30 06:00 1.50 WAIT ON CEMENT.

24.00

TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: Bit, MM(1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS

CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =



y'ays 4 jft 5-20 G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/14/2004 Days: 6
Depth: 890' PB Prog: OPR: WAIT ON CElliENY Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 1,162 TMC: $ 8,570 TDC: $ $ 37,660 CWC: $ $ 331,797

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 1 RR Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 surf.csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: size: 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 10.0 GPM: Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Coment: $ 23,943

WL: nC NV: Jets: 3 - 18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers; $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids; FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chls: 18,000 Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 0.80/6.00 FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,162
ca: 40 wos: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 37,660

06:00 08:30 2.50 WAIT ON CEMENT. cum.wtr: $ 10,788

08:30 09:00 0.50 HELD PRE-JOB AND SAFETY MEETING. cum.Fuel $ 6,609

09:00 09:30 0.50 TEST LINETO 1,000 PSIG. MIXAND PUMP 340 SKS CLASS "G" cum.Bits: $ 12,000
+ 0.75% CACL2 + 10% SILICA FLOUR + 1.0% DISPERSANT cumRot: 31.0

AT 17.5 PPG. YIELD = 1.09 CUFT/SK. WATER = 4.6 GAL/SK.
SET AS BALANCED PLUG. FULLRETURNS THROUGHOUT JOB.

09:30 10:00 0.50 PULL OUT OF HOLE 4 STANDS TO 837 FT.
10:00 11:00 1.00 CIRCULATE 1-1/2 TIMES BOTTOMS UP. CIRCULATED 14 BBLS CEMENT COLORED

COLORED WATER TO RESERVE PIT.
11:00 11:30 0.50 PULL OUT OF HOLE.
11:30 06:00 18.50 WAIT ON CEMENT.

24.00
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BHA: Bit, MM(1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =
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13 //fE Sad G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/16/2004 Days: 8

Depth: 946' Prog: OPR: Formation:

DMC: $ 396 TMC: $ 9,352 TDC: $ $ 21,031 CWC: $ $ 390,189

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 1 RR conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10421265 surf.ceg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 160 Size: 12-1/4" Int. cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,310 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 10.4 GPM: 515 Type: XS36 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: DC NV: 109 Jets: 3 - 18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 98/146 In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 deg Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905

Chis: 18,000 Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 0.80/4.90 FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 396

ca: 40 wos: 2 - 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. / Labor: $ -

Timi Break Doun: RPM: 50 / 72 Mise: $ - Dir Driller: S 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 21,031

06:00 14:00 8.00 TIME DRILLTO KICKOFF CEMENT PLUG FROM 885 TO 918 FT. cum.wtr: $ 10,788

4.125 FPH. Cum. Fuei $ 6,609

14:00 23:30 9.50 TIME DRILLTO KICKOFF CEMENT PLUG FROM 918 TO 928 FT. cum.Bits: $ 12,000

1.05 FPH. cumRot: 31.0

23:30 04:30 5.00 TIME DRILLTO KlCKOFF CEMENT PLUG FROM 928 TO 940 FT.

2.40 FPH.
04:30 06:00 1.50 TIME DRILLTO KlCK OFF CEMENT PLUG FROM 940 TO 946 FT.

4.0 FPH.

MWD CHECK SHOT SURVEYS:
843 FT = 0.97 DEG AT 159.91 AZIMUTH.

874 FT = 0.83 DEG AT 164.49 AZIMUTH.

906 FT = 0.46 DEG AT 175.10 AZIMUTH.

24.00

UP = 83,000 lbs. DOWN = 78,000 lbs. TRIP GAS
DRILLCEMENT PLUG = 33.0 HRS. CONN
BHA: Bit, MM (1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFlELD Total length =
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DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT
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UP = 83,000 lbs. DOWN = 78,000 lbs. TRIP GAS
DRILLCEMENT PLUG = 33.0 HRS. CONN
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afs </TE s-a, GAO PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT i L |

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/17/2004 Days: 9
Depth: 1033' Prog: 87 OPR: MOTOR DIRECTIO JAL DRILL Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 478 TMC: $ 9,830 TDC: $ $ 39,840 cwc: $ $ 430,029
Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: |\l i TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #; 1 RR 2 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke; 10 SIN: 10421265 10628926 Surf. cag: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 160 size: 12-1/4" 12-1/4" int. ceg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800
Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,310 MFG: SECURITY SECURITY Prod Csg; $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 10.2 GPM: 515 Type: XS36S XS30S Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 109 Jets: 3 - 18 3 - 18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 98/146 In: 918 986 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 6,727
sand: Dev: 1 deg out: 986 DRLG Packers; $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 12,000
Solids: 1.0 FTG: 68 47 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905
Chis: 18,000 Hrs: 27.5 6 separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.40/4.80 FPH: 2.5 7.83 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850
LCM: TIBIG: 4-4-1/16" NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 478
ca: 40 WOB: 2 - 15 10 - 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Doun: RPM: 50 / 72 50 / 74 Misc: $ - Dir Driller: $ 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 39,840
06:00 12:00 6.00 SLIDE TIME DRILLFROM 946 TO 966 FT. 20 FT AT 3,33 FPH. cum.Wtr: $ 10,788
12:00 12:30 0.50 RIG REPAIR. MUDPUMP. Cum. Fuel $ 13,336
12:30 14:30 2.00 SLIDE TIME DRILLFROM 966 TO 975 FT. 9 FT AT 4.5 FPH. Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
14:30 15:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 928 FT = 0.21 DEG AT 205.15 AZIMUTH. cumRot: 64.5
15:00 16:30 1.50 SLIDE TIME DRILLFROM 975 TO 981 FT. 6 FT AT 4.0 FPH.
16:30 17:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 938 FT = 0.15 DEG AT 269.72 AZIMUTH.
17:00 19:00 2.00 DIRECTIONALMOTOR DRILLFROM 981 TO 986 FT. 5 FT AT 2.50 FPH.
19:00 20:30 1.50 LAYDOWN 4 JOINTS DRILLPIPE. PULL OUT OF HOLE. NO PROBLEMS.
20:30 22:30 2.00 MAKEUP NEW BIT. RUN IN HOLE.
22:30 23:30 1.00 WASH AND REAM SIDETRACK HOLE FROM 886 TO 986 FT.
23:30 02:30 3.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL986 TO 1,011 FT. 25 FT AT 8.33 FPH.
02:30 03:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 968 FT = 0.28 DEG AT 329.97 DEG AZIMUTH.
03;00 06:00 3.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,011 TO 1,033 FT. 22 FT AT 7.33 FPH.

24.00

UP = 85,000 Ibs. DOWN = 80,000 lbs. TRIP GAS
CONN

BHA: Bit, MM(1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =
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Cake: AV: 98/146 In: 918 986 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 6,727
sand: Dev: 1 deg out: 986 DRLG Packers; $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 12,000
Solids: 1.0 FTG: 68 47 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 905
Chis: 18,000 Hrs: 27.5 6 separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.40/4.80 FPH: 2.5 7.83 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850
LCM: TIBIG: 4-4-1/16" NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 478
ca: 40 WOB: 2 - 15 10 - 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Doun: RPM: 50 / 72 50 / 74 Misc: $ - Dir Driller: $ 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 39,840
06:00 12:00 6.00 SLIDE TIME DRILLFROM 946 TO 966 FT. 20 FT AT 3,33 FPH. cum.Wtr: $ 10,788
12:00 12:30 0.50 RIG REPAIR. MUDPUMP. Cum. Fuel $ 13,336
12:30 14:30 2.00 SLIDE TIME DRILLFROM 966 TO 975 FT. 9 FT AT 4.5 FPH. Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
14:30 15:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 928 FT = 0.21 DEG AT 205.15 AZIMUTH. cumRot: 64.5
15:00 16:30 1.50 SLIDE TIME DRILLFROM 975 TO 981 FT. 6 FT AT 4.0 FPH.
16:30 17:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 938 FT = 0.15 DEG AT 269.72 AZIMUTH.
17:00 19:00 2.00 DIRECTIONALMOTOR DRILLFROM 981 TO 986 FT. 5 FT AT 2.50 FPH.
19:00 20:30 1.50 LAYDOWN 4 JOINTS DRILLPIPE. PULL OUT OF HOLE. NO PROBLEMS.
20:30 22:30 2.00 MAKEUP NEW BIT. RUN IN HOLE.
22:30 23:30 1.00 WASH AND REAM SIDETRACK HOLE FROM 886 TO 986 FT.
23:30 02:30 3.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL986 TO 1,011 FT. 25 FT AT 8.33 FPH.
02:30 03:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 968 FT = 0.28 DEG AT 329.97 DEG AZIMUTH.
03;00 06:00 3.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,011 TO 1,033 FT. 22 FT AT 7.33 FPH.

24.00

UP = 85,000 Ibs. DOWN = 80,000 lbs. TRIP GAS
CONN

BHA: Bit, MM(1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =



-roy A/m s-as GAO PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT L

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/18/2004 Days: 10
Depth: 1389' Prog: 356' OPR: SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL. Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 840 TMC: $ 10,670 TDC: $ $ 24,347 CWC: $ $ 454,376

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: lii I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 2 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 stroke: 10 SIN: 10628926 Surf. cag: $ - Location: $
PvlYP: 1/1 SPM: 180 size: 12-1/4" Int. cag: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,780 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: 580 Type: XS30S Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: OC NV: 249 Jets: 3 - 18 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 109/146 In: 986 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits I corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 403 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 905

Chls: 18,000 Hrs: 23 Separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.40/4,80 FPH: 17.52 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 840
Ca: 20 WOB: 15 - 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: S 2,872

RPM: 50 / 81 Misc: $ - Dir Driller: $ 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 24,347

06:00 18:30 12.50 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,033 TO 1,190 FT WITH cum.wtr: $ 10,788

MWD SURVEYS. SURVEYS = 3.5 HRS. DRILLING= 9.0 HRS. cum.Fuei $ 13,336

157 FT AT 17.44 FPH. Cum. Bits: S 24,000
18:30 19:00 0.50 ROTARY DIRECTIONAL DRILLFROM 1,190 TO 1,204 FT. cumRot: 81.5

14 FT AT 28.0 FPH.

19:00 19:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,161 FT = 3.38 DEG AT 353.3 DEG AZIMUTH.
19:30 21:30 2.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,204 TO 1,235 FT. 31 FT AT 15.5 FPH.
21:30 22:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,192 FT = 3.54 DEG AT 348.52 DEG AZIMUTH.
22:00 01:30 3.50 ROTARY DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,235 TO 1,331 FT WITH MWD SURVEYS.

SURVEY = 1-1/2 HRS. ROTATING = 2 HRS. 96 FT AT 48.0 FPH.
01:30 03:30 2.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,331 TO 1,363 FT. 32 FT AT 16 FPH.
03:30 04:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,320 FT = 4.20 DEG AT 346.76 DEG AZIMUTH.

04:00 05:00 1.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,363 TO 1,379 FT. 16 FT AT 16.0 FPH.
05:00 05:30 0.50 RIG REPAIR. TIGHTEN BELTS ON No. 2 PUMP.
05:30 06:00 0.50 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,379 TO 1,389 FT. 10 FT AT 20.0 FPH.

MWD SURVEY AT 1,352 FT = 3.60 DEG AT 347.5 DEGAZIMUTH.
24.00 NOTE: SEE ATTACHED SURVEY SHEET FOR ALLSURVEYS.

UP = 86,000 lbs. DOWN = 84,000 lbs. ROTATING = 85,000 Ibs. TRIP GAS
BIT No.1 DULL= 5 - 5 - FC - ALL - 5E - 1/16" - FC - PR. CONN
BHA: Bit, MM (1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =
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Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/18/2004 Days: 10
Depth: 1389' Prog: 356' OPR: SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL. Formation: UNITA
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PvlYP: 1/1 SPM: 180 size: 12-1/4" Int. cag: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800
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PflMf: 1.40/4,80 FPH: 17.52 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 840

Ca: 20 WOB: 15 - 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: S 2,872
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19:00 19:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,161 FT = 3.38 DEG AT 353.3 DEG AZIMUTH.
19:30 21:30 2.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,204 TO 1,235 FT. 31 FT AT 15.5 FPH.
21:30 22:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,192 FT = 3.54 DEG AT 348.52 DEG AZIMUTH.
22:00 01:30 3.50 ROTARY DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,235 TO 1,331 FT WITH MWD SURVEYS.

SURVEY = 1-1/2 HRS. ROTATING = 2 HRS. 96 FT AT 48.0 FPH.
01:30 03:30 2.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,331 TO 1,363 FT. 32 FT AT 16 FPH.
03:30 04:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,320 FT = 4.20 DEG AT 346.76 DEG AZIMUTH.

04:00 05:00 1.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,363 TO 1,379 FT. 16 FT AT 16.0 FPH.
05:00 05:30 0.50 RIG REPAIR. TIGHTEN BELTS ON No. 2 PUMP.
05:30 06:00 0.50 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,379 TO 1,389 FT. 10 FT AT 20.0 FPH.

MWD SURVEY AT 1,352 FT = 3.60 DEG AT 347.5 DEGAZIMUTH.
24.00 NOTE: SEE ATTACHED SURVEY SHEET FOR ALLSURVEYS.

UP = 86,000 lbs. DOWN = 84,000 lbs. ROTATING = 85,000 Ibs. TRIP GAS
BIT No.1 DULL= 5 - 5 - FC - ALL - 5E - 1/16" - FC - PR. CONN
BHA: Bit, MM (1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =



sg, GAO PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/19/2004 Days: 11
Depth: 1,669' Prog: 280' OPR: SLIDE DIRECTIONAL DRILL Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 1,167 TMC: $ 11,837 TDC: $ $ 26,043 CWC: $ $ 480,419

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: I i I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10628926 surf.cag: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 180 Size: 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,780 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: 580 Type: XS30S Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: OC NV: 249 Jets: 3 - 18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 109/146 In: 986 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 1,875

Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits I corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 683 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,005

Chis: 19,000 Hrs: 42 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.10/4.80 FPH: 16.26 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping L/T: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,167

ca: 40 wos: 15 - 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,266

Time Break Dos m: RPM: 50 / 81 Misc: $ - Dir Driller: $ 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 26,043

06:00 06:30 0.50 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,389 TO 1,395 FT. 12.0 FPH. cum.wtr: $ 12,663

06:30 07:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,352 FT = 3.60 DEG AT 347.45 DEG AZIMUTH cum.Fuei $ 13,336

07:00 11:30 4.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,395 TO 1,491 FT WITH MWD cum.Bits: $ 24,000

SURVEYS. SURVEYS = 1-1/2 HR. DRLG = 3 HRS. 32.0 FPH. cumRot: 100.5

11:30 15:00 3.50 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,491 TO 1,523 FT WlMWD SURVEYS. SURV EY = 1/2 HR.
DRILLING= 3 HRS. 10.67 FPH.

15:00 15:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE.
15:30 20:00 4.50 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,523 TO 1,555 FT. 7.11 FPH.
20:00 20:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,512 FT = 2.88 DEG AT 345.33 DEG AZIMUTH.
20:30 21:30 1.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,555 TO 1,587 FT. 32.0 FPH.
21:30 22:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,544 FT = 2.31 DEG AT 343.25 DEG AZIMUTH.
22:00 01:00 3.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL FROM 1,587 TO 1,619 FT. 10.67 FPH.
01:00 01:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,576 FT = 2.35 DEG AT 343.41 DEG AZIMUTH.
01:30 02:30 1.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,619 TO 1,651 FT. 32.0 FPH.
02:30 03:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,607 FT = 2.02 DEG AT 344.16 DEG AZIMUTH.

03:00 06:00 3.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILLFROM 1,651 TO 1,669 FT. 6.0 FPH.

24.00 NOTE: SEE ATTACHED SURVEY SHEET FOR ALLSURVEYS.

UP = 95,000 lbs. DOWN = 9 1,000 lbs. ROTATING = 92,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: Bit, MM(1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =
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01:00 01:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,576 FT = 2.35 DEG AT 343.41 DEG AZIMUTH.
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24.00 NOTE: SEE ATTACHED SURVEY SHEET FOR ALLSURVEYS.

UP = 95,000 lbs. DOWN = 9 1,000 lbs. ROTATING = 92,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: Bit, MM(1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =



GkO PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT ' i

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/19/2004 Days: 12

Depth: 1985' Proq: 316' OPR: ROTARY DIRECTICNALDRILL Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 405 TMC: $ 12,242 TDC: $ $ 21,140 CWC: $ $ 501,559

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: lii I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

Vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10628926 surf.csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 size: 12-1/4" Int Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 870 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: 422 Type: XS30S Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 181 Jets: 3 - 18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger; $ -

Cake: AV: 79/112 In: 986 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $
Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 999 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,005

Chls: 18,000 Hrs: 61 separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.20/4.70 FPH: 16.37 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 405

ca: 20 wos: 15 - 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 50 / 59 Misc: $ - Dir Driller: S 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 21,140

06:00 07:00 1.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL 1,669 TO 1,682 FT. 13.0 FPH. Cum. Wtr: $ 12,663

07:00 07:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,639 FT = 2.24 DEG AT 343.34 DEG AZIMUTH. Cum. Fuel $ 13,336

07:30 09:30 2.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,682 TO 1,712 FT. 15.0 FPH. cum.Bits: $ 24,000

09:30 10:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,669 FT = 2.07 DEG AT 342.66 DEG AZIMUTH. cumRot: 119.5

10:00 12:00 2.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,712 TO 1,718 FT. 3.0 FPH.
12:00 14:00 2.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,718 TO 1,744 FT. 13.0 FPH.
14;00 14:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,700 FT = 2.09 DEG AT 350.60 DEG AZIMUTH.
14:30 19:30 5.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,744 TO 1,775 FT. 6.2 FPH.
19:30 20:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,731 FT = 2.01 DEG AT 352.39 DEG AZIMUTH.
20:00 21:30 1.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,775 TO 1,807 FT. 21.33 FPH.
21:30 22:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,764 FT = 1.71 DEG AT 350.79 DEG AZIMUTH.
22:00 06:00 8.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 1,764 TO 1,985 FT WITH MWD SURVEYS.

SURVEYS = 2.5 HRS. DRLG = 5.5 HRS. 221 FT AT 40.18 FPH.
NOTE LOST No. 1 PUMP MOTOR AT 1,790 FT (20:45 HRS)

NOTE RECOVERED BLACKTAR TYPE SUBSTANCE FROM 1,710 TO 1,735 FT. SIZE VARIED

FROM 1-3" WIDE BY 3-6" LONG BY 1/2 - 1" THICK.
24.00 NOTE: SEE ATTACHED SURVEY SHEET FOR ALL SURVEYS.

UP = 100,000 lbs. DOWN = 95,000 lbs. ROTATING = 97,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: Bit, MM (1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" de, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =

GkO PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT ' i

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/19/2004 Days: 12

Depth: 1985' Proq: 316' OPR: ROTARY DIRECTICNALDRILL Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 405 TMC: $ 12,242 TDC: $ $ 21,140 CWC: $ $ 501,559

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: lii I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

Vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10628926 surf.csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 size: 12-1/4" Int Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 870 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: 422 Type: XS30S Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 181 Jets: 3 - 18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger; $ -

Cake: AV: 79/112 In: 986 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $
Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 999 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,005

Chls: 18,000 Hrs: 61 separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.20/4.70 FPH: 16.37 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 405

ca: 20 wos: 15 - 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 50 / 59 Misc: $ - Dir Driller: S 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 21,140

06:00 07:00 1.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL 1,669 TO 1,682 FT. 13.0 FPH. Cum. Wtr: $ 12,663

07:00 07:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,639 FT = 2.24 DEG AT 343.34 DEG AZIMUTH. Cum. Fuel $ 13,336

07:30 09:30 2.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,682 TO 1,712 FT. 15.0 FPH. cum.Bits: $ 24,000

09:30 10:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,669 FT = 2.07 DEG AT 342.66 DEG AZIMUTH. cumRot: 119.5

10:00 12:00 2.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,712 TO 1,718 FT. 3.0 FPH.
12:00 14:00 2.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,718 TO 1,744 FT. 13.0 FPH.
14;00 14:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,700 FT = 2.09 DEG AT 350.60 DEG AZIMUTH.
14:30 19:30 5.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,744 TO 1,775 FT. 6.2 FPH.
19:30 20:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,731 FT = 2.01 DEG AT 352.39 DEG AZIMUTH.
20:00 21:30 1.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,775 TO 1,807 FT. 21.33 FPH.
21:30 22:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,764 FT = 1.71 DEG AT 350.79 DEG AZIMUTH.
22:00 06:00 8.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 1,764 TO 1,985 FT WITH MWD SURVEYS.

SURVEYS = 2.5 HRS. DRLG = 5.5 HRS. 221 FT AT 40.18 FPH.
NOTE LOST No. 1 PUMP MOTOR AT 1,790 FT (20:45 HRS)

NOTE RECOVERED BLACKTAR TYPE SUBSTANCE FROM 1,710 TO 1,735 FT. SIZE VARIED

FROM 1-3" WIDE BY 3-6" LONG BY 1/2 - 1" THICK.
24.00 NOTE: SEE ATTACHED SURVEY SHEET FOR ALL SURVEYS.

UP = 100,000 lbs. DOWN = 95,000 lbs. ROTATING = 97,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: Bit, MM (1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" de, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =

GkO PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT ' i

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/19/2004 Days: 12

Depth: 1985' Proq: 316' OPR: ROTARY DIRECTICNALDRILL Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 405 TMC: $ 12,242 TDC: $ $ 21,140 CWC: $ $ 501,559

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: lii I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

Vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10628926 surf.csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 size: 12-1/4" Int Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 870 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: 422 Type: XS30S Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nc NV: 181 Jets: 3 - 18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger; $ -

Cake: AV: 79/112 In: 986 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $
Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 999 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,005

Chls: 18,000 Hrs: 61 separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.20/4.70 FPH: 16.37 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 405

ca: 20 wos: 15 - 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 50 / 59 Misc: $ - Dir Driller: S 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 21,140

06:00 07:00 1.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL 1,669 TO 1,682 FT. 13.0 FPH. Cum. Wtr: $ 12,663

07:00 07:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,639 FT = 2.24 DEG AT 343.34 DEG AZIMUTH. Cum. Fuel $ 13,336

07:30 09:30 2.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,682 TO 1,712 FT. 15.0 FPH. cum.Bits: $ 24,000

09:30 10:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,669 FT = 2.07 DEG AT 342.66 DEG AZIMUTH. cumRot: 119.5

10:00 12:00 2.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,712 TO 1,718 FT. 3.0 FPH.
12:00 14:00 2.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,718 TO 1,744 FT. 13.0 FPH.
14;00 14:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,700 FT = 2.09 DEG AT 350.60 DEG AZIMUTH.
14:30 19:30 5.00 SLIDE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,744 TO 1,775 FT. 6.2 FPH.
19:30 20:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,731 FT = 2.01 DEG AT 352.39 DEG AZIMUTH.
20:00 21:30 1.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,775 TO 1,807 FT. 21.33 FPH.
21:30 22:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,764 FT = 1.71 DEG AT 350.79 DEG AZIMUTH.
22:00 06:00 8.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 1,764 TO 1,985 FT WITH MWD SURVEYS.

SURVEYS = 2.5 HRS. DRLG = 5.5 HRS. 221 FT AT 40.18 FPH.
NOTE LOST No. 1 PUMP MOTOR AT 1,790 FT (20:45 HRS)

NOTE RECOVERED BLACKTAR TYPE SUBSTANCE FROM 1,710 TO 1,735 FT. SIZE VARIED

FROM 1-3" WIDE BY 3-6" LONG BY 1/2 - 1" THICK.
24.00 NOTE: SEE ATTACHED SURVEY SHEET FOR ALL SURVEYS.

UP = 100,000 lbs. DOWN = 95,000 lbs. ROTATING = 97,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: Bit, MM (1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" de, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =



p yy g ¿yg s-se G O PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT L !

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/21/2004 Days: 13
Depth: 2575' Prog: 590' OPR: ROTATE DIRECTIC MALDRILL Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 1,511 TMC: $ 13,753 TDC: $ $ 28,497 CWC: $ $ 530,056

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: Ai I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10628926 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 165 Size: 12-1/4" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,610 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: 562 Type: XS30S Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: AC NV: 241 Jets: 3 - 18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 106/130 In: 986 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 6,251

Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1,589 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,005

chis: 19,000 Hrs: 81.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.30/4.90 FPH: 19.5 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,511
ca: 40 wos: 18 - 24 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 50 / 78 Misc: $ - Dir Driller: $ 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 28,497

06:00 06:30 0.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,985 TO 1,997 FT. 24.0 FPH. Cum. wtr; $ 12,663

06:30 07:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,954 FT = 1.00 DEG AT 329.83 DEG AZIMUTH Cum. Fuel $ 19,587

07:00 10:30 3.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,997 TO 2,061 FT. 18.3 FPH. cum.Bits: $ 24,000
10:30 11:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,018 FT = 0.92 DEG AT 326.61 DEG AZIMUTH cumRot: 140.0
11:00 15:00 4.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,061 TO 2,156 FT. 23.8 FPH.

15:00 15:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,113 FT, = 0.62 DEG AT 329.43 DEG AZIMUTH.

15:30 18:30 3.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,156 TO 2,252 FT. 32.0 FPH.

18:30 19:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,209 FT = 0.70 DEG AT 300.15 DEG AZIMUTH.
19:00 21:30 2.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONAL DRILL2,252 TO 2,348 FT. 38.4 FPH.
21:30 22:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,305 FT = 0.56 DEG AT 267.05 DEG AZIMUTH.
22:00 01:30 3.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,348 TO 2,444 FT. 27.4 FPH.

01:30 02:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,400 FT = 0.55 DEG AT 265.47 DEG AZIMUTH.
02:00 04:30 2.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,444 TO 2,539 FT. 38.0 FPH.
04:30 05:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,496 FT = 0.46 DEG AT 264.51 DEG AZIMUTH.

05;00 06:00 1.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,539 TO 2,575 FT. 36.0 FPH.

NOTE No. 1 PUMP MOTOR BACKON LINEAT 17:00 HRS.
24.00 NOTE: SEE ATTACHED SURVEY SHEET FOR ALLSURVEYS.

UP = 107,000 lbs. DOWN = 00,000 lbs. ROTATING = 102,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: Bit, MM(1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =

p yy g ¿yg s-se G O PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT L !

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/21/2004 Days: 13
Depth: 2575' Prog: 590' OPR: ROTATE DIRECTIC MALDRILL Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 1,511 TMC: $ 13,753 TDC: $ $ 28,497 CWC: $ $ 530,056

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: Ai I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10628926 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 165 Size: 12-1/4" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,610 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: 562 Type: XS30S Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: AC NV: 241 Jets: 3 - 18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 106/130 In: 986 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 6,251

Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1,589 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,005

chis: 19,000 Hrs: 81.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.30/4.90 FPH: 19.5 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,511
ca: 40 wos: 18 - 24 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 50 / 78 Misc: $ - Dir Driller: $ 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 28,497

06:00 06:30 0.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,985 TO 1,997 FT. 24.0 FPH. Cum. wtr; $ 12,663

06:30 07:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,954 FT = 1.00 DEG AT 329.83 DEG AZIMUTH Cum. Fuel $ 19,587

07:00 10:30 3.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,997 TO 2,061 FT. 18.3 FPH. cum.Bits: $ 24,000

10:30 11:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,018 FT = 0.92 DEG AT 326.61 DEG AZIMUTH cumRot: 140.0
11:00 15:00 4.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,061 TO 2,156 FT. 23.8 FPH.

15:00 15:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,113 FT, = 0.62 DEG AT 329.43 DEG AZIMUTH.

15:30 18:30 3.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,156 TO 2,252 FT. 32.0 FPH.

18:30 19:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,209 FT = 0.70 DEG AT 300.15 DEG AZIMUTH.
19:00 21:30 2.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONAL DRILL2,252 TO 2,348 FT. 38.4 FPH.
21:30 22:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,305 FT = 0.56 DEG AT 267.05 DEG AZIMUTH.
22:00 01:30 3.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,348 TO 2,444 FT. 27.4 FPH.

01:30 02:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,400 FT = 0.55 DEG AT 265.47 DEG AZIMUTH.
02:00 04:30 2.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,444 TO 2,539 FT. 38.0 FPH.
04:30 05:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,496 FT = 0.46 DEG AT 264.51 DEG AZIMUTH.

05;00 06:00 1.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,539 TO 2,575 FT. 36.0 FPH.

NOTE No. 1 PUMP MOTOR BACKON LINEAT 17:00 HRS.
24.00 NOTE: SEE ATTACHED SURVEY SHEET FOR ALLSURVEYS.

UP = 107,000 lbs. DOWN = 00,000 lbs. ROTATING = 102,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: Bit, MM(1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =

p yy g ¿yg s-se G O PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT L !

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/21/2004 Days: 13
Depth: 2575' Prog: 590' OPR: ROTATE DIRECTIC MALDRILL Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 1,511 TMC: $ 13,753 TDC: $ $ 28,497 CWC: $ $ 530,056

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: Ai I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10628926 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 165 Size: 12-1/4" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,610 MFG: SECURITY Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: 562 Type: XS30S Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: AC NV: 241 Jets: 3 - 18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 106/130 In: 986 TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 6,251

Sand: Dev: Out: DRLG Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1,589 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,005

chis: 19,000 Hrs: 81.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.30/4.90 FPH: 19.5 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,511
ca: 40 wos: 18 - 24 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 50 / 78 Misc: $ - Dir Driller: $ 8,080

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 28,497

06:00 06:30 0.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,985 TO 1,997 FT. 24.0 FPH. Cum. wtr; $ 12,663

06:30 07:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 1,954 FT = 1.00 DEG AT 329.83 DEG AZIMUTH Cum. Fuel $ 19,587

07:00 10:30 3.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL1,997 TO 2,061 FT. 18.3 FPH. cum.Bits: $ 24,000

10:30 11:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,018 FT = 0.92 DEG AT 326.61 DEG AZIMUTH cumRot: 140.0
11:00 15:00 4.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,061 TO 2,156 FT. 23.8 FPH.

15:00 15:30 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,113 FT, = 0.62 DEG AT 329.43 DEG AZIMUTH.

15:30 18:30 3.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,156 TO 2,252 FT. 32.0 FPH.

18:30 19:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,209 FT = 0.70 DEG AT 300.15 DEG AZIMUTH.
19:00 21:30 2.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONAL DRILL2,252 TO 2,348 FT. 38.4 FPH.
21:30 22:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,305 FT = 0.56 DEG AT 267.05 DEG AZIMUTH.
22:00 01:30 3.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,348 TO 2,444 FT. 27.4 FPH.

01:30 02:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,400 FT = 0.55 DEG AT 265.47 DEG AZIMUTH.
02:00 04:30 2.50 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,444 TO 2,539 FT. 38.0 FPH.
04:30 05:00 0.50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,496 FT = 0.46 DEG AT 264.51 DEG AZIMUTH.

05;00 06:00 1.00 ROTATE DIRECTIONALDRILL2,539 TO 2,575 FT. 36.0 FPH.

NOTE No. 1 PUMP MOTOR BACKON LINEAT 17:00 HRS.
24.00 NOTE: SEE ATTACHED SURVEY SHEET FOR ALLSURVEYS.

UP = 107,000 lbs. DOWN = 00,000 lbs. ROTATING = 102,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: Bit, MM(1.83), UBHO, 2 - 6-1/2" Monel dc, 3-8" dc, xo, 21-6-3/8" dc. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: BOB HOSFIELD Total length =



yog g /yg S-ad G O PRODUCTION COMPAY
pg 4 DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/22/2004 Days: 14
Depth: 2919' Prog: 344' OPR: DRLG Formation: UNITA
DMC; $ 1,533 TMC: $ 15,286 TDC: $ $ 34,268 Cwc: $ $ 564,324

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: Ai I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 2 3 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10628926 MT 6084 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 200 Size: 12-1/4" 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,460 MFG: SECURITY STC Prod cag: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: 696 Type: XS30S F4 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: nC Dev: Jets: 3 - 18 3 - 28 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: In: 986 2,735 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: 2,735 INC Packers: $ - Bits I corehead: $ 12,000

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1,749 184 Tanks; $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,005

Chis: 18,000 Hrs: 91 91 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1.10/5.00 FPH: 19.2 33.5 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: NA Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,533
ca: 40 wos: 18 - 24 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dos m: RPM: 50 / 78 55 / 112 Mise: $ - Forklift: $ 8,080

START
_

END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 34,268

06:00 08:00 2:00 ROTATIONALDRILL2,571 FT TO 2,634 FT. 31.5 FPH. Cum. wtr: $ 12,663

08:00 08:30 0:50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,591 FT = 1.97 DEG AT 210.96 DEG AZIMUTH Cum. Fuel $ 19,587

08:30 09:30 1:00 ROTATIONALDRILL2,634 FT TO 2,667 FT. 33.0 FPH. cum.Bits: $ 36,000
09:30 10:00 0:50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,624 FT = 1.87 DEG AT 210.71 DEG AZIMUTH cumRot: 140.0

10:00 12:30 2:50 SLIDE DRILLAT 2,667 FT TO 2,697 FT 12.0 FPH
12:30 13:00 0:50 RIG SERVCE, SURVEY AT 2,654 FT 1.64 AT 211.31 DEG AZIMUTH
13:00 14:00 1:00 ROTATIONAL DRILL 2,697 FT TO 2,735 FT. 38.0 FPH
14:00 14:30 0:50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,686 FT = 1.53 DEG AT 191.8 DEG AZIMUTH
14:30 15:00 0:50 PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY, SET BACK KELLY,LD 2 JTS DP
15:00 17:30 2:50 TOH (TOTCO DEPTH 2,640 FT SURVEY 1.5 DEG)
17:30 19:30 2:00 LD DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
19:30 22:00 2:50 TIH W/ BIT N° 3, MOTOR, DC'S AND DP
22:00 23:00 1:00 WASH & REAM2,600 TO 2,735 FT

23:00 01:00 2:00 DRLG 2,735 FT TO 2,793 FT (58 FT, 29 FPH).
01:00 02:30 1:50 CIRCULATEAND SURVEY AT 2740 FT 1.5 DEG
02:30 06:00 3:50 DRLG 2,793 FT TO 2,919 FT (126 FT, 36 FPH).

UP = 110,000 lbs. DOWN = 100,000 lbs. ROTATING = 102,000 Ibs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: Bit, .16 MM,21-6-3/8" DC's. Total length = 774.00 BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: J.

yog g /yg S-ad G O PRODUCTION COMPAY
pg 4 DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/22/2004 Days: 14
Depth: 2919' Prog: 344' OPR: DRLG Formation: UNITA
DMC; $ 1,533 TMC: $ 15,286 TDC: $ $ 34,268 Cwc: $ $ 564,324
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VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10628926 MT 6084 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 200 Size: 12-1/4" 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,460 MFG: SECURITY STC Prod cag: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.5 GPM: 696 Type: XS30S F4 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -
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01:00 02:30 1:50 CIRCULATEAND SURVEY AT 2740 FT 1.5 DEG
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ca: 40 wos: 18 - 24 40-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dos m: RPM: 50 / 78 55 / 112 Mise: $ - Forklift: $ 8,080

START
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END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 34,268
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14:00 14:30 0:50 MWD SURVEY AT 2,686 FT = 1.53 DEG AT 191.8 DEG AZIMUTH
14:30 15:00 0:50 PUMP PILL, DROP SURVEY, SET BACK KELLY,LD 2 JTS DP
15:00 17:30 2:50 TOH (TOTCO DEPTH 2,640 FT SURVEY 1.5 DEG)
17:30 19:30 2:00 LD DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
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22:00 23:00 1:00 WASH & REAM2,600 TO 2,735 FT

23:00 01:00 2:00 DRLG 2,735 FT TO 2,793 FT (58 FT, 29 FPH).
01:00 02:30 1:50 CIRCULATEAND SURVEY AT 2740 FT 1.5 DEG
02:30 06:00 3:50 DRLG 2,793 FT TO 2,919 FT (126 FT, 36 FPH).

UP = 110,000 lbs. DOWN = 100,000 lbs. ROTATING = 102,000 Ibs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: Bit, .16 MM,21-6-3/8" DC's. Total length = 774.00 BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: J.



ro15Ñyg 5-ap G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/23/2004 Days: 15
Depth: 3559' Proq: 640' OPR: DRILLINC Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 1,430 TMC: $ 16,717 TDC: $ $ 15,985 CWC: $ $ 580,309

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 3 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke; 10 SIN: MT 6084 surf.cag: $ - Location: $ -

PvlYP: 1/1 SPM: 200 Size: 12-1/4" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,460 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,900
ph: 9.3 GPM: 696 Type: F4 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: DC Dev: Jets: 3 - 28 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: In: 2,735 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: INC Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

soilds: 1.0 FTG: 624 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,005

Chis: 19,000 Hrs: 26 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .80/5.40 FPH: 31.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,430

ca: 40 wos: 35-45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 55 / 112 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 15,985

06:00 09:00 3.00 DRLG 2919' - 3015' (96 FT, 32 FPH). Cum. wtr: $ 12,663
09:00 09:30 0.50 SURVEY AT 3015', 2 DEG. Cum. Fuel $ 19,587

09:30 10:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE. cum.Bits: $ 36,000
10:00 21:30 11.50 DRLG 3015' - 3335' (320 FT, 27.8 FPH). cumRot: 166.0
21:30 23:00 1.50 SURVEY AT 3270', 1-3/4 DEG.
23:00 06:00 7.00 DRLG 3335' - 3559' (224 FT, 32.0 FPH).

UP = 110,000 lbs. DOWN = 00,000 lbs. ROTATING = 102,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: 12-1/4" Bit, MUD MOTOR, 21-6-3/8" DC's. Total length = 774.00 BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: J.
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AEW TECH ENGINEERING Û

0 2 6 CASING AND CEMENTING WORKSHEET

COMPANY GASCO PRODUCTIONCOMPANY
WELL NAME FEDERAL43-30-9-19 d ý-
LEGALS NE/SE, SEC 30, T9S R19E
COUNTYI STATE UNITAH/ UTAH
DATE 23 AUGUST2004 REPRESENTATIVE J DUNCAN

CASINGSIZE: 8-5/8"

DESCRIPTION (BOTTOM TO TOP): LENGTH

CIUANTITY

1 DAVIS-LYNCH8-5/8" K-55 Brd EUE ST&CSELF-FILLINGFLOATSHOE 1.70
1 JOINT 8-5/8" K-55 28.0 LB/FT Brd EUE ST&C 43.33
1 DAVIS-LYNCH8-5/8" K-55 8rd EUE ST&CSELF-FILLINGFLOAT COLLAR 1.55
6 JOINTS 8-5/8" K-55 28.0 LB/FTBrd EUE ST&C 259.03
77 JOINTS 8-5/8" J-55 32.0 LB/FT8rd EUE ST&C 3,295.21
1 WELLHEADINC., 13-3/8"X 8-5/8" CASING HANGER, 2,00
1 LANDINGJOINT 8-5/8" K-55 28.0 LB/FTACMETHREAD 22.00

CORRECTI3N FOR THREAD MAKE UP (2.09)

TOTAL CASINGAND EQUIPMENT RUN 3,622.73
STRAP OF CASINGABOVE RKB 3.80
RKB TO CHF 18.33
CUTOFFCASINGLENGTH 22.13
CASING IN HOLE 3,600.60
CASINGLANDEDAT 3,618.93
LENGTH OF SHOE, SHOE JTS, AND FLOAT COLLAR 46.58
FLOAT COLLAR AT 3,572.35

CENTRALIZERSAT

RUNNINGAND CEMENTING DETAILS

HELDPRE-JOB ANDSAFETYMEETING. TEST CEMENTLINETO 3,500 PSIG, OKAY.

PUMPED 20 BBLS FRESH WATER SPACER.
LEAD SLURRY: 635 SKS HI-LIFT+ 11.28 LBS/SK BENTONITEEXTENDER+ 0.94 LBS/SK CHEMICALEXTENDER+ 10.2 LBS/SK SALT

+ 0.235 LBSISKFLAC(FLUIDLOSS) AT 11.0 PPG, YIELD3,91 CUFT/SK. WATER = 24.5 GAL/SK.

TAILSLURRY: 260 SKS RFC 10-2 + 9.4 LBS/SK GYPSUM + 1.88 LBS/SK CALCIUMCHLORIDE+ 0.25 LBS/SK POLYESTER FLAKE
AT 14.2 PPG, YIELD1.63 CUFT/SK. WATER = 7.91 GAL/SK.

DISPLACEMENT: 218 BBLS8.5 PPG DRILLINGFLUID, BUMPEDPLUG, FLOATHELD.

JOB SUMMARY
CEMENT: CEMENT3622' OF 8-5/8" CSG. PUMP 20 BBLS FRESH WTR, 635 SKS Hi-LIFT
CEMENT (11.0 PPG, 3.91 YLD,24.5 GPS), 260 SKS 10-2 RFC CEMENT
(14.2 PPG, 1.63 YLD, ¯/.91 GPS), DROP PLUG ANDDISPLACETO FLOATWITHWTR.
NOTE: CIRC 100+ BBLS OF CEMENTTO SURFACE, CMT FELLBACK 1 FTIMIN, ALLOW
CMTTO SET AND FALLBACKFOR 1 HR, FILL8-5/8" BACKSIDE WITH6 BBLS CMT,
CMT HELDGOOD TO SURFACE.
JOHNNY BOWEN WITHBLMWAS NOTIFIED- DECLINEDTO
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+ 0.235 LBSISKFLAC(FLUIDLOSS) AT 11.0 PPG, YIELD3,91 CUFT/SK. WATER = 24.5 GAL/SK.

TAILSLURRY: 260 SKS RFC 10-2 + 9.4 LBS/SK GYPSUM + 1.88 LBS/SK CALCIUMCHLORIDE+ 0.25 LBS/SK POLYESTER FLAKE
AT 14.2 PPG, YIELD1.63 CUFT/SK. WATER = 7.91 GAL/SK.

DISPLACEMENT: 218 BBLS8.5 PPG DRILLINGFLUID, BUMPEDPLUG, FLOATHELD.

JOB SUMMARY
CEMENT: CEMENT3622' OF 8-5/8" CSG. PUMP 20 BBLS FRESH WTR, 635 SKS Hi-LIFT
CEMENT (11.0 PPG, 3.91 YLD,24.5 GPS), 260 SKS 10-2 RFC CEMENT
(14.2 PPG, 1.63 YLD, ¯/.91 GPS), DROP PLUG ANDDISPLACETO FLOATWITHWTR.
NOTE: CIRC 100+ BBLS OF CEMENTTO SURFACE, CMT FELLBACK 1 FTIMIN, ALLOW

CMTTO SET AND FALLBACKFOR 1 HR, FILL8-5/8" BACKSIDE WITH6 BBLS CMT,
CMT HELDGOOD TO SURFACE.
JOHNNY BOWEN WITHBLMWAS NOTIFIED- DECLINEDTO



GkO PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/24/2004 Days: 16

Depth: 3655' Prog: 96' OPR: NIPPLE UP LOP Formation: UNITA
DMC: $ 1606 TMC: $ 18323 TDC: $ $ 59,585 CWC: $ $ 639,894

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 3 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT 6084 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PvlYP: 1/1 SPM: 200 size: 12-1/4" int. csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,460 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 300

ph: 9.3 GPM: 696 Type: F4 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ 36,000

WL: AC Dev: Jets: 3 - 28 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: TD = 1-3/4° In: 2,735 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: out: 3,655 Packem: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 920 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,005

Chls: 15,000 Hrs: 29.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 31.2 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,430

ca: 40 wos: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 9,200

Time Break Dos m: RPM: 55 / 112 Misc: S - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 59,585

06:00 09:30 3.00 DRLG 3559' - 3655' (96 FT, 27.4 FPH). Cum. Wtr: $ 12,663

09:30 10:30 1.00 PUMP SWEEP, CIRC AND CONDITION HOLE. Cum. Fuei $ 19,587

10:30 12:30 2.00 DROP SURVEY, TOOH. (HOLE FLOWING 1/4 - 1/2 BPM) cum.Bits: $ 36,000

12:30 13:30 1.00 RU FRANKS CASING SERVICE. Cum Rot: 169.5

13:30 14:00 0.50 LDXO SUB, 3-8" DC'S AND MUDMOTOR, (SURVEY AT TD = 1-3/4°.).

14:00 14:30 0.50 RU FRANKS CASING SERVICE.

14:30 18:30 4.50 RUN 84 JTS OF 8-5/8" 28# & 32# CASING, LANDAT 3622.33 FT.

18:30 19:30 1.00 CIRC HOLE WI RIG PUMP AND RD FRANKS WESTATES CASING SERVICES.

19:30 24:00 4.50 RU SCHLUMBERGER AND CMT SURFACE CASING, BUMPED PLUG, (PLUG HELD GOOD).

24:00 00:30 0.50 RD SCHLUMBERGER.

00:30 02:00 1.50 ND DRLG NIPPLE AND NU WELLHEAD.

02:00 06:00 4.00 NU BOP

CEMENT: CEMENT 3622' OF 8-5/8" CSG. PUMP 20 BBLS FRESH WTR, 635 SKS HI-LIFT

CEMENT (11.0 PPG, 3.91 YLD, 24.5 GPS), 260 SKS 10-2 RFC CEMENT

(14.2 PPG, 1.63 YLD, 7.91 GPS), DROP PLUG AND DISPLACE TO FLOATWITH WTR.

NOTE: CIRC 100+ BBLS OF CEMENT TO SURFACE, CMT FELL BACK 1 FTIMIN,ALLOW

CMT TO SET AND FALLBACK FOR 1 HR, FILL8-5/8" BACKSIDE WITH 6 BBLS CMT,

CMT HELD GOOD TO SURFACE.

UP = 110,000 lbs. DOWN = 00,000 lbs. ROTATING = 102,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN

BHA: 12-1/4" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 3-8" DC's, XO SUB, 21-6-3/8" DC's. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length =

GkO PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT
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GkO PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT
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START END TIME BHA: 65,000 lbs Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 59,585
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-rors x/fr 5-se GÊCO PRODUCTION COMAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT '

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/25/2004 Days: 17

Depth: 3850' Prog: 195' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: UNITA

DMC: $ 34 TMc: $ 18357 TDC: $ $ 89,989 CWC: $ $ 730,059

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10537641 Surf. csg: $ 72,000 Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,330 MFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 400

ph: 9.5 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: OC Dev: Jets: 3-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: In: 3655 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 3,600

Sand: Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 195 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,005

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 4 1/2 separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 43.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 34

ca: 40 wos: 35 Prime Mover; $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,300

Time Break Down: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ 72,000 Daily Total: $ 17,989

06:00 13:30 7.50 NU BOP. cum.wtr: $ 16,263

13:30 19:00 5.50 PRESSURE TEST 5000 PSI BOP (BLMREP - CADE TAYLOR). Cum. Fuel $ 19,587

19:00 23:30 4.50 TIH WI BIT N°4. cum.Bits: $ 36,000

23:30 01:30 2.00 DRLG CMT AND FLOAT EQUIPMENT. Cum Rot: 174.0

01:30 12:00 4.50 DRLG 3655' - 3850', (195 FT, 43.3 FPH).

COLUMBINE LOGGING OSITE AT 3655'

UP = 120,000 lbs. DOWN = 105,000 Ibs. ROTATING = 111,000 lbs. TRIP GAS NA

CONN NA

BHA: 7-7/8"" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23-6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS NA

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length =

-rors x/fr 5-se GÊCO PRODUCTION COMAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT '
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-rors x/fr 5-se GÊCO PRODUCTION COMAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT '

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/25/2004 Days: 17
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Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
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Time Break Down: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ 72,000 Daily Total: $ 17,989

06:00 13:30 7.50 NU BOP. cum.wtr: $ 16,263

13:30 19:00 5.50 PRESSURE TEST 5000 PSI BOP (BLMREP - CADE TAYLOR). Cum. Fuel $ 19,587

19:00 23:30 4.50 TIH WI BIT N°4. cum.Bits: $ 36,000

23:30 01:30 2.00 DRLG CMT AND FLOAT EQUIPMENT. Cum Rot: 174.0
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TWS /fa sao G o PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/26/2004 Days: 18

Depth: 4865' Prog: 1015' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: UNITA

DMC: $ 1396 TMC: $ 19754 TDC: $ $ 31,736 CWC: $ $ 761,795

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 sit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke; 10 SIN: 10537641 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,330 MFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,980

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 Fioat Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 4106 = 2° In: 3655 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

sand: 4600 = 1-1/4° Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 6,500

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1210 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chls: 15,000 Hrs: 26.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 45.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,396

ca: 40 Wos: 35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,085

Time Break Dot o: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - FUEL $ 7,000

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 31,736

06:00 11:00 5.00 DRLG 3850' - 4106' (256 FT, 51.2 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

11:00 12:00 1.00 SURVEY AT 4106' = 2°. Cum. Fuei $ 26,587

12:00 12:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Bits: $ 42,500

12:30 23:30 11.00 DRLG 4106' - 4615' (509 FT, 46.3 FPH). Cum Rot: 196.0

23:30 24:00 0.50 SURVEY AT 4600' = 1-3/4°.

24:00 6:00 6.00 DRLG 4615' - 4865' (250 FT, 41.6 FPH).

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 72 500 4100

UP = 132,000 lbs. DOWN = 20,000 lbs. ROTATING = 126,000 lbs. DEPTH 4880

BG GAS 30

BHA: 7-7/8"" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23-6-3/8" DC. BHA Total length = 745.00 CONN GAS 175

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN TRIP GAS

TWS /fa sao G o PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT
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Chls: 15,000 Hrs: 26.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 45.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,396

ca: 40 Wos: 35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,085

Time Break Dot o: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - FUEL $ 7,000

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 31,736

06:00 11:00 5.00 DRLG 3850' - 4106' (256 FT, 51.2 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

11:00 12:00 1.00 SURVEY AT 4106' = 2°. Cum. Fuei $ 26,587

12:00 12:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Bits: $ 42,500

12:30 23:30 11.00 DRLG 4106' - 4615' (509 FT, 46.3 FPH). Cum Rot: 196.0

23:30 24:00 0.50 SURVEY AT 4600' = 1-3/4°.

24:00 6:00 6.00 DRLG 4615' - 4865' (250 FT, 41.6 FPH).

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 72 500 4100

UP = 132,000 lbs. DOWN = 20,000 lbs. ROTATING = 126,000 lbs. DEPTH 4880

BG GAS 30

BHA: 7-7/8"" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23-6-3/8" DC. BHA Total length = 745.00 CONN GAS 175

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN TRIP GAS

TWS /fa sao G o PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT
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DMC: $ 1396 TMC: $ 19754 TDC: $ $ 31,736 CWC: $ $ 761,795

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: M I DRLG FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 sit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke; 10 SIN: 10537641 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,330 MFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,980

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 Fioat Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 4106 = 2° In: 3655 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

sand: 4600 = 1-1/4° Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 6,500

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1210 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chls: 15,000 Hrs: 26.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 45.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,396

ca: 40 Wos: 35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,085

Time Break Dot o: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - FUEL $ 7,000

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 31,736

06:00 11:00 5.00 DRLG 3850' - 4106' (256 FT, 51.2 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

11:00 12:00 1.00 SURVEY AT 4106' = 2°. Cum. Fuei $ 26,587

12:00 12:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Bits: $ 42,500

12:30 23:30 11.00 DRLG 4106' - 4615' (509 FT, 46.3 FPH). Cum Rot: 196.0

23:30 24:00 0.50 SURVEY AT 4600' = 1-3/4°.

24:00 6:00 6.00 DRLG 4615' - 4865' (250 FT, 41.6 FPH).

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 72 500 4100

UP = 132,000 lbs. DOWN = 20,000 lbs. ROTATING = 126,000 lbs. DEPTH 4880

BG GAS 30

BHA: 7-7/8"" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23-6-3/8" DC. BHA Total length = 745.00 CONN GAS 175

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN TRIP GAS



To 8 g/7£ S-Jo GÑCO PRODUCTION COMAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/27/2004 Days: 19

Depth: 5632' Prog: 767' OPR: DRILLINC Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $ 6438 TMC: $ 26192 TDC: $ $ 22,213 CWC: $ $ 784,008

Contractor: NABORS Mud Co: MI DRL FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 4 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 stroke; 10 SIN: 10537641 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,330 MFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - BHA; $ 2,000

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 5520' = 1-1/4° in: 3655 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: out: NA Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1977 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 49.0 Separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 40 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 6,438

DAP 5.6 Wos: 35-40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dos n: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 22,213

06:00 17:00 11.00 DRLG 4865' - 5311' (446 FT, 40.5 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

17:00 18:00 1.00 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Fuel $ 26,587

18:00 04:30 10.50 DRLG 5311' - 5600' (289 FT, 27.5 FPH). Cum. Bits: S 42,500

04:30 05:00 0.50 SURVEY AT 5520' = 1-1/4°. Cum Rot: 218.5

05:00 06:00 1.00 DRLG 5600' - 5632' (32 FT, 32 FPH).

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 67 420 5343'

UP = 150,000 lbs. DOWN = 132,000 lbs. ROTATING = 140,000 lbs. DEPTH 5603

BG GAS 20-40

BHA: 7-7/8"" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23-6-3/8" DC. BHA Total length = 745.00 CONN GAS 175

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN TRIP GAS

To 8 g/7£ S-Jo GÑCO PRODUCTION COMAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/27/2004 Days: 19

Depth: 5632' Prog: 767' OPR: DRILLINC Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $ 6438 TMC: $ 26192 TDC: $ $ 22,213 CWC: $ $ 784,008

Contractor: NABORS Mud Co: MI DRL FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 4 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 stroke; 10 SIN: 10537641 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,330 MFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - BHA; $ 2,000

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 5520' = 1-1/4° in: 3655 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: out: NA Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1977 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 49.0 Separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 40 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 6,438

DAP 5.6 Wos: 35-40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dos n: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 22,213

06:00 17:00 11.00 DRLG 4865' - 5311' (446 FT, 40.5 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

17:00 18:00 1.00 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Fuel $ 26,587

18:00 04:30 10.50 DRLG 5311' - 5600' (289 FT, 27.5 FPH). Cum. Bits: S 42,500

04:30 05:00 0.50 SURVEY AT 5520' = 1-1/4°. Cum Rot: 218.5

05:00 06:00 1.00 DRLG 5600' - 5632' (32 FT, 32 FPH).

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 67 420 5343'

UP = 150,000 lbs. DOWN = 132,000 lbs. ROTATING = 140,000 lbs. DEPTH 5603

BG GAS 20-40

BHA: 7-7/8"" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23-6-3/8" DC. BHA Total length = 745.00 CONN GAS 175

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN TRIP GAS

To 8 g/7£ S-Jo GÑCO PRODUCTION COMAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/27/2004 Days: 19

Depth: 5632' Prog: 767' OPR: DRILLINC Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $ 6438 TMC: $ 26192 TDC: $ $ 22,213 CWC: $ $ 784,008

Contractor: NABORS Mud Co: MI DRL FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 4 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 stroke; 10 SIN: 10537641 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,330 MFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - BHA; $ 2,000

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 5520' = 1-1/4° in: 3655 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: out: NA Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1977 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 49.0 Separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 40.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 40 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 6,438

DAP 5.6 Wos: 35-40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dos n: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 22,213

06:00 17:00 11.00 DRLG 4865' - 5311' (446 FT, 40.5 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

17:00 18:00 1.00 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Fuel $ 26,587

18:00 04:30 10.50 DRLG 5311' - 5600' (289 FT, 27.5 FPH). Cum. Bits: S 42,500

04:30 05:00 0.50 SURVEY AT 5520' = 1-1/4°. Cum Rot: 218.5

05:00 06:00 1.00 DRLG 5600' - 5632' (32 FT, 32 FPH).

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 67 420 5343'

UP = 150,000 lbs. DOWN = 132,000 lbs. ROTATING = 140,000 lbs. DEPTH 5603

BG GAS 20-40

BHA: 7-7/8"" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23-6-3/8" DC. BHA Total length = 745.00 CONN GAS 175

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN TRIP GAS



ofs A/ÿ¿ 5-30 G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/28/2004 Days: 20

Depth: 6174' KB Prog: 542' OPR: RIG REPA R Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $ 657 TMC: $ 26850 TDC: $ $ 16,007 CWC: $ $ 800,015

Contractor: NABORS Mud Co: MIDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10537641 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,330 MFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,575

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: In: 3655 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2519 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 66.5 separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 37.9 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 657

DAP 5.3 wos: 35-40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,007

06:00 09:30 3.50 DRLG 5632' - 5729' (97 FT, 27.7 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

09:30 10:30 1.00 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 26,587

10:30 24:30 14.00 DRLG 5729' - 6174' (445 FT, 31.79 FPH). Cum. Bits: $ 42,500

24:30 01:00 0.50 CIRC BOTTOMS UP. Cum Rot: 236.0

1:00 02:30 1.50 DROP SURVEY, TRIP OUT TO 3492'.

02:30 06:00 3.50 RIG REPAIR - DP SLIP DIES FAILED.

NOT ABLE TO REMOVE SLIP DIES FROM SLIP BODIES, HOTSHOT NEW SLIPS OUT

OF VERNAL UTAH.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 72 460 6014'

UP = 160,000 lbs. DOWN = 40,000 lbs. ROTATING = 150,000 lbs. DEPTH 6174

BG GAS 20-40

BHA: 7-7/8"" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23-6-3/8" DC. BHA Total length = 745.00 CONN GAS 110

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN TRIP GAS

ofs A/ÿ¿ 5-30 G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/28/2004 Days: 20

Depth: 6174' KB Prog: 542' OPR: RIG REPA R Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $ 657 TMC: $ 26850 TDC: $ $ 16,007 CWC: $ $ 800,015

Contractor: NABORS Mud Co: MIDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10537641 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,330 MFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,575

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: In: 3655 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2519 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 66.5 separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 37.9 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 657

DAP 5.3 wos: 35-40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,007

06:00 09:30 3.50 DRLG 5632' - 5729' (97 FT, 27.7 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

09:30 10:30 1.00 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 26,587

10:30 24:30 14.00 DRLG 5729' - 6174' (445 FT, 31.79 FPH). Cum. Bits: $ 42,500

24:30 01:00 0.50 CIRC BOTTOMS UP. Cum Rot: 236.0

1:00 02:30 1.50 DROP SURVEY, TRIP OUT TO 3492'.

02:30 06:00 3.50 RIG REPAIR - DP SLIP DIES FAILED.

NOT ABLE TO REMOVE SLIP DIES FROM SLIP BODIES, HOTSHOT NEW SLIPS OUT

OF VERNAL UTAH.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 72 460 6014'

UP = 160,000 lbs. DOWN = 40,000 lbs. ROTATING = 150,000 lbs. DEPTH 6174

BG GAS 20-40

BHA: 7-7/8"" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23-6-3/8" DC. BHA Total length = 745.00 CONN GAS 110

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN TRIP GAS

ofs A/ÿ¿ 5-30 G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/28/2004 Days: 20

Depth: 6174' KB Prog: 542' OPR: RIG REPA R Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $ 657 TMC: $ 26850 TDC: $ $ 16,007 CWC: $ $ 800,015

Contractor: NABORS Mud Co: MIDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10537641 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1,330 MFG: SEC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,575

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: In: 3655 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2519 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 66.5 separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 37.9 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 657

DAP 5.3 wos: 35-40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 40-137 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,007

06:00 09:30 3.50 DRLG 5632' - 5729' (97 FT, 27.7 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

09:30 10:30 1.00 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 26,587

10:30 24:30 14.00 DRLG 5729' - 6174' (445 FT, 31.79 FPH). Cum. Bits: $ 42,500

24:30 01:00 0.50 CIRC BOTTOMS UP. Cum Rot: 236.0

1:00 02:30 1.50 DROP SURVEY, TRIP OUT TO 3492'.

02:30 06:00 3.50 RIG REPAIR - DP SLIP DIES FAILED.

NOT ABLE TO REMOVE SLIP DIES FROM SLIP BODIES, HOTSHOT NEW SLIPS OUT

OF VERNAL UTAH.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 72 460 6014'

UP = 160,000 lbs. DOWN = 40,000 lbs. ROTATING = 150,000 lbs. DEPTH 6174

BG GAS 20-40

BHA: 7-7/8"" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23-6-3/8" DC. BHA Total length = 745.00 CONN GAS 110

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN TRIP GAS



7-af.5 /7E s,so G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/29/2004 Days: 21

Depth: 6585' KB Prog: 411' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $ 418 TMc: $ 27269 TDC: $ $ 22,573 CWC: $ $ 822,588

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLE FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10537641 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1280 MFG: SEC HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 880

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 DSX199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 6094' = 1-1/4° In: 3655 6174 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: 6174 NA Packem: $ - Bits I corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2519 6585 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 66.5 411 separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 37.9 58.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 418

DAP 5.4 wos: 35-40 15-20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 40-137 40-67 Mise: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 22,573

06:00 10:30 4.50 SLIP AND CUT 160' DRLG LINE. (WAITON SLIPS). Cum. wtr: $ 16,263

10:30 13:00 2.50 CONTINUE TRIP OUT (SURVEY AT 6094 = 1-1/4°). Cum. Fuei $ 26,587

13:00 15:00 2.00 LD MUDMOTOR AND PU NEW BHA. Cum. Bits: $ 50,000

15:00 18:00 3.00 TRIP INW/ BIT N° 5. Cum Rot: 243.0

18:00 19:00 1.00 INSTALLNEW ROTATION HEAD RUBBER.

19:00 20:30 1.50 CONTINUE TRIP IN HOLE AND LD4 JTS DP.

20:30 21:00 0.50 INSTALLROTATING HEAD DRIVE BUSHING.

21:00 22:30 1.50 WASH AND REAM 6050' - 6174'.

22:30 5:30 7.00 DRLG 6174' - 6585' (411 FT, 58.7 FPH).

5:30 6:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 73 440 6200'

UP = 175,000 lbs. DOWN = 145,000 lbs. ROTATING = 155,000 lbs. DEPTH 6521

BG GAS 80-100

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 182

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 683.12.00 TRIP GAS

7-af.5 /7E s,so G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/29/2004 Days: 21

Depth: 6585' KB Prog: 411' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $ 418 TMc: $ 27269 TDC: $ $ 22,573 CWC: $ $ 822,588

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLE FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10537641 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1280 MFG: SEC HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 880

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 DSX199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 6094' = 1-1/4° In: 3655 6174 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: 6174 NA Packem: $ - Bits I corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2519 6585 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 66.5 411 separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 37.9 58.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 418

DAP 5.4 wos: 35-40 15-20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 40-137 40-67 Mise: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 22,573

06:00 10:30 4.50 SLIP AND CUT 160' DRLG LINE. (WAITON SLIPS). Cum. wtr: $ 16,263

10:30 13:00 2.50 CONTINUE TRIP OUT (SURVEY AT 6094 = 1-1/4°). Cum. Fuei $ 26,587

13:00 15:00 2.00 LD MUDMOTOR AND PU NEW BHA. Cum. Bits: $ 50,000

15:00 18:00 3.00 TRIP INW/ BIT N° 5. Cum Rot: 243.0

18:00 19:00 1.00 INSTALLNEW ROTATION HEAD RUBBER.

19:00 20:30 1.50 CONTINUE TRIP IN HOLE AND LD4 JTS DP.

20:30 21:00 0.50 INSTALLROTATING HEAD DRIVE BUSHING.

21:00 22:30 1.50 WASH AND REAM 6050' - 6174'.

22:30 5:30 7.00 DRLG 6174' - 6585' (411 FT, 58.7 FPH).

5:30 6:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 73 440 6200'

UP = 175,000 lbs. DOWN = 145,000 lbs. ROTATING = 155,000 lbs. DEPTH 6521

BG GAS 80-100

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 182

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 683.12.00 TRIP GAS

7-af.5 /7E s,so G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/29/2004 Days: 21

Depth: 6585' KB Prog: 411' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $ 418 TMc: $ 27269 TDC: $ $ 22,573 CWC: $ $ 822,588

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLE FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 10537641 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1280 MFG: SEC HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 880

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: XS27 DSX199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 3-16 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 6094' = 1-1/4° In: 3655 6174 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: 6174 NA Packem: $ - Bits I corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2519 6585 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 66.5 411 separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: 1/5 FPH: 37.9 58.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 418

DAP 5.4 wos: 35-40 15-20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 40-137 40-67 Mise: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 22,573

06:00 10:30 4.50 SLIP AND CUT 160' DRLG LINE. (WAITON SLIPS). Cum. wtr: $ 16,263

10:30 13:00 2.50 CONTINUE TRIP OUT (SURVEY AT 6094 = 1-1/4°). Cum. Fuei $ 26,587

13:00 15:00 2.00 LD MUDMOTOR AND PU NEW BHA. Cum. Bits: $ 50,000

15:00 18:00 3.00 TRIP INW/ BIT N° 5. Cum Rot: 243.0

18:00 19:00 1.00 INSTALLNEW ROTATION HEAD RUBBER.

19:00 20:30 1.50 CONTINUE TRIP IN HOLE AND LD4 JTS DP.

20:30 21:00 0.50 INSTALLROTATING HEAD DRIVE BUSHING.

21:00 22:30 1.50 WASH AND REAM 6050' - 6174'.

22:30 5:30 7.00 DRLG 6174' - 6585' (411 FT, 58.7 FPH).

5:30 6:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 73 440 6200'

UP = 175,000 lbs. DOWN = 145,000 lbs. ROTATING = 155,000 lbs. DEPTH 6521

BG GAS 80-100

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 182

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 683.12.00 TRIP GAS



pg y ye s-so GkO PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/30/2004 Days: 22

Depth: 7676' Prog: 1091' OPR: DRILLINC Formation: WASATCH
DMc: $ 1154 TMC: $ 28423 TDC: $ $ 17,904 CWC: $ $ 840,492

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1280 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,275

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 7015' = 2 3/4° In: 6174 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1502 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 29.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.7 FPH: 50.9 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,154

DAP 5.4 Wos: 12-15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 700

Time Break Dos in: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,904

06:00 16:00 10.00 DRLG 6585' - 7096' (511 FT, 51.1 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

16:00 17:00 1.00 SURVEY AT 7015' = 2-3/4°. cum.Fuel ; 26,587

17:00 05:30 12.50 DRLG 7096' - 7676' (580 FT, 46.4 FPH). cum.Bits: $ 50,000

05:00 06:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE. Cum Rot: 265.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 71 460 7160'

UP = 195,000 lbs. DOWN = 150,000 lbs. ROTATING = 168,000 lbs. DEPTH 7645

BG GAS 80-110

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUDMOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 125

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.98 TRIP GAS

pg y ye s-so GkO PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/30/2004 Days: 22

Depth: 7676' Prog: 1091' OPR: DRILLINC Formation: WASATCH

DMc: $ 1154 TMC: $ 28423 TDC: $ $ 17,904 CWC: $ $ 840,492

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1280 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,275

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 7015' = 2 3/4° In: 6174 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1502 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 29.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.7 FPH: 50.9 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,154

DAP 5.4 Wos: 12-15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 700

Time Break Dos in: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,904

06:00 16:00 10.00 DRLG 6585' - 7096' (511 FT, 51.1 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

16:00 17:00 1.00 SURVEY AT 7015' = 2-3/4°. cum.Fuel ; 26,587

17:00 05:30 12.50 DRLG 7096' - 7676' (580 FT, 46.4 FPH). cum.Bits: $ 50,000

05:00 06:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE. Cum Rot: 265.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 71 460 7160'

UP = 195,000 lbs. DOWN = 150,000 lbs. ROTATING = 168,000 lbs. DEPTH 7645

BG GAS 80-110

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUDMOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 125

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.98 TRIP GAS

pg y ye s-so GkO PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/30/2004 Days: 22

Depth: 7676' Prog: 1091' OPR: DRILLINC Formation: WASATCH

DMc: $ 1154 TMC: $ 28423 TDC: $ $ 17,904 CWC: $ $ 840,492

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1280 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,275

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 7015' = 2 3/4° In: 6174 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 1502 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 29.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.7 FPH: 50.9 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,154

DAP 5.4 Wos: 12-15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 700

Time Break Dos in: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,904

06:00 16:00 10.00 DRLG 6585' - 7096' (511 FT, 51.1 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,263

16:00 17:00 1.00 SURVEY AT 7015' = 2-3/4°. cum.Fuel ; 26,587

17:00 05:30 12.50 DRLG 7096' - 7676' (580 FT, 46.4 FPH). cum.Bits: $ 50,000

05:00 06:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE. Cum Rot: 265.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 71 460 7160'

UP = 195,000 lbs. DOWN = 150,000 lbs. ROTATING = 168,000 lbs. DEPTH 7645

BG GAS 80-110

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUDMOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 125

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.98 TRIP GAS



ffg 6-30 GkO PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/31/2004 Days: 23

Depth: 8255' KB Prog: 579' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $ 628 TMC: $ 29051 TDC: $ $ 25,424 CWC: $ $ 865,916

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" int. Csg: S - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,070

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

cake: In: 6174 TBGIRods; $ - water: $ 325

Sand: Out; NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2081 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chls: 15,000 Hrs: 52.5 separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

Pf/Mf: .5/5.7 FPH: 39.6 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

Ca: 120 TIBiG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,154

DAP 5.2 wos: 10-20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,000

Timt Break Dos m: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - FUEL $ 7,100

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 25,424

06:00 13:00 7.00 DRLG 7676' - 7858' (182 FT, 26 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,588

13:00 14:00 1.00 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Fuei $ 33,687

14:00 06:00 16.00 DRLG 7858' - 8255' (397 FT, 24.8 FPH). Cum. Bits: $ 50,000

Cum Rot: 265.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 67 440 8082'

UP = 205,000 lbs. DOWN = 170,000 lbs. ROTATING = 185,000 lbs. DEPTH 8228

BG GAS 60-100

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 280
CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.98 TRIP GAS

ffg 6-30 GkO PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/31/2004 Days: 23

Depth: 8255' KB Prog: 579' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $ 628 TMC: $ 29051 TDC: $ $ 25,424 CWC: $ $ 865,916

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" int. Csg: S - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,070

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

cake: In: 6174 TBGIRods; $ - water: $ 325

Sand: Out; NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2081 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chls: 15,000 Hrs: 52.5 separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

Pf/Mf: .5/5.7 FPH: 39.6 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

Ca: 120 TIBiG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,154

DAP 5.2 wos: 10-20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,000

Timt Break Dos m: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - FUEL $ 7,100

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 25,424

06:00 13:00 7.00 DRLG 7676' - 7858' (182 FT, 26 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,588

13:00 14:00 1.00 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Fuei $ 33,687

14:00 06:00 16.00 DRLG 7858' - 8255' (397 FT, 24.8 FPH). Cum. Bits: $ 50,000

Cum Rot: 265.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 67 440 8082'

UP = 205,000 lbs. DOWN = 170,000 lbs. ROTATING = 185,000 lbs. DEPTH 8228

BG GAS 60-100

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 280
CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.98 TRIP GAS

ffg 6-30 GkO PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 8/31/2004 Days: 23

Depth: 8255' KB Prog: 579' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $ 628 TMC: $ 29051 TDC: $ $ 25,424 CWC: $ $ 865,916

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 26 Stroke: 10 SIN: 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" int. Csg: S - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,070

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

cake: In: 6174 TBGIRods; $ - water: $ 325

Sand: Out; NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2081 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chls: 15,000 Hrs: 52.5 separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

Pf/Mf: .5/5.7 FPH: 39.6 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

Ca: 120 TIBiG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,154

DAP 5.2 wos: 10-20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,000

Timt Break Dos m: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - FUEL $ 7,100

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 25,424

06:00 13:00 7.00 DRLG 7676' - 7858' (182 FT, 26 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,588

13:00 14:00 1.00 RIG SERVICE. Cum. Fuei $ 33,687

14:00 06:00 16.00 DRLG 7858' - 8255' (397 FT, 24.8 FPH). Cum. Bits: $ 50,000

Cum Rot: 265.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 67 440 8082'

UP = 205,000 lbs. DOWN = 170,000 lbs. ROTATING = 185,000 lbs. DEPTH 8228

BG GAS 60-100

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 280
CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.98 TRIP GAS



TufS Ñ/9E SA>$G$CO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/1/2004 Days: 24

Depth: 8715' Prog: 460' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $ 780 TMC: $ 29831 TDC: $ $ 16,670 CWC: $ $ 882,060

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRL FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 stroke; 10 SIN: 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1460 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,115

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: In: 6174 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2541 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 76 Separator: $ - Trucking: $ -

Pf/Mf: .5/5.6 FPH: 33.4 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 780

DAP 5.1 WOB: 10-20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,670

06:00 14:00 8.00 DRLG 8255' - 8413' (158 FT, 19.75 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,588

14:00 14:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 33,687

14:30 06:00 15.50 DRLG 8413' - 8715' (302 FT, 19.48 FPH). cum.Bits: $ 50,000

cumRot: 318.5

BEGIN MUD UP AT 8500 FT.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 74 440 8497'

UP = 215,000 lbs. DOWN = 80,000 lbs. ROTATING = 190,000 lbs. DEPTH 8698

BG GAS 80-120

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8'"' DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1010
CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.98 TRIP GAS

TufS Ñ/9E SA>$G$CO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/1/2004 Days: 24

Depth: 8715' Prog: 460' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $ 780 TMC: $ 29831 TDC: $ $ 16,670 CWC: $ $ 882,060

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRL FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 stroke; 10 SIN: 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1460 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,115

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: In: 6174 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2541 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 76 Separator: $ - Trucking: $ -

Pf/Mf: .5/5.6 FPH: 33.4 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 780

DAP 5.1 WOB: 10-20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,670

06:00 14:00 8.00 DRLG 8255' - 8413' (158 FT, 19.75 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,588

14:00 14:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 33,687

14:30 06:00 15.50 DRLG 8413' - 8715' (302 FT, 19.48 FPH). cum.Bits: $ 50,000

cumRot: 318.5

BEGIN MUD UP AT 8500 FT.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 74 440 8497'

UP = 215,000 lbs. DOWN = 80,000 lbs. ROTATING = 190,000 lbs. DEPTH 8698

BG GAS 80-120

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8'"' DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1010
CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.98 TRIP GAS

TufS Ñ/9E SA>$G$CO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/1/2004 Days: 24

Depth: 8715' Prog: 460' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $ 780 TMC: $ 29831 TDC: $ $ 16,670 CWC: $ $ 882,060

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRL FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 26 stroke; 10 SIN: 109212 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1460 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,115

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: Dev: Jets: 6-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: In: 6174 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Out: NA Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1.0 FTG: 2541 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 76 Separator: $ - Trucking: $ -

Pf/Mf: .5/5.6 FPH: 33.4 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 780

DAP 5.1 WOB: 10-20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,670

06:00 14:00 8.00 DRLG 8255' - 8413' (158 FT, 19.75 FPH). cum.wtr: $ 16,588

14:00 14:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 33,687

14:30 06:00 15.50 DRLG 8413' - 8715' (302 FT, 19.48 FPH). cum.Bits: $ 50,000

cumRot: 318.5

BEGIN MUD UP AT 8500 FT.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 74 440 8497'

UP = 215,000 lbs. DOWN = 80,000 lbs. ROTATING = 190,000 lbs. DEPTH 8698

BG GAS 80-120

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8'"' DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1010
CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.98 TRIP GAS



po my J" ogCO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/2/2004 Days: 25

Depth: 8849' Prog: 134' OPR: WASH AND F EAM Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $ 6391 TMC: $ 36223 TDC: $ $ 29,636 CWC: $ $ 911,696

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLf FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.8 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 33 Stroke: 10 SIN: 109212 105619 Surf. Cag: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 3/6 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" int. Cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/10/14 Press: 1460 MFG: HYCALOG HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,060

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NA Dev: Jets: 6-16 4-14, 3-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake; 2/ 8768' = 3° In: 6174 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: NA out: 8849 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 2.0 FTG: 2675 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chls: 15,000 Hrs: 85 NONE Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.8 FPH: 31.5 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

Ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 6,391

DAP 5.3 wos: 10-25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 910

Time Break Dos m: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 29,636

06:00 15:00 9.00 DRLG 8715' - 8849' (134 FT, 14.9 FPH). Cum. wtr: $ 16,588

15:00 04:00 13.00 TRIP FOR BIT N°6, (SURVEY AT 8768' = 3°), cum.Fuei $ 33,687

04:00 6:00 2.00 WASH AND REAM8705' - 8817'. Cum. Bits: $ 67,500

Cum Rot: 327.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 73 460 8721'

UP = 215,000 lbs. DOWN = 80,000 lbs. ROTATING = 197,000 lbs. DEPTH 8849

BG GAS 120-160

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1010
CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS

po my J" ogCO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/2/2004 Days: 25

Depth: 8849' Prog: 134' OPR: WASH AND F EAM Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $ 6391 TMC: $ 36223 TDC: $ $ 29,636 CWC: $ $ 911,696

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLf FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.8 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 33 Stroke: 10 SIN: 109212 105619 Surf. Cag: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 3/6 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" int. Cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/10/14 Press: 1460 MFG: HYCALOG HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,060

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NA Dev: Jets: 6-16 4-14, 3-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake; 2/ 8768' = 3° In: 6174 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: NA out: 8849 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 2.0 FTG: 2675 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chls: 15,000 Hrs: 85 NONE Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.8 FPH: 31.5 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

Ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 6,391

DAP 5.3 wos: 10-25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 910

Time Break Dos m: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 29,636

06:00 15:00 9.00 DRLG 8715' - 8849' (134 FT, 14.9 FPH). Cum. wtr: $ 16,588

15:00 04:00 13.00 TRIP FOR BIT N°6, (SURVEY AT 8768' = 3°), cum.Fuei $ 33,687

04:00 6:00 2.00 WASH AND REAM8705' - 8817'. Cum. Bits: $ 67,500

Cum Rot: 327.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 73 460 8721'

UP = 215,000 lbs. DOWN = 80,000 lbs. ROTATING = 197,000 lbs. DEPTH 8849

BG GAS 120-160

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1010
CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS

po my J" ogCO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/2/2004 Days: 25

Depth: 8849' Prog: 134' OPR: WASH AND F EAM Formation: WASATCH
DMC: $ 6391 TMC: $ 36223 TDC: $ $ 29,636 CWC: $ $ 911,696

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLf FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.8 Liner: 6 Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 33 Stroke: 10 SIN: 109212 105619 Surf. Cag: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 3/6 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" int. Cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/10/14 Press: 1460 MFG: HYCALOG HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,060

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX199 DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NA Dev: Jets: 6-16 4-14, 3-16 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake; 2/ 8768' = 3° In: 6174 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: NA out: 8849 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 2.0 FTG: 2675 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,350

Chls: 15,000 Hrs: 85 NONE Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.8 FPH: 31.5 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

Ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - DrillingMud: $ 6,391

DAP 5.3 wos: 10-25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 910

Time Break Dos m: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 29,636

06:00 15:00 9.00 DRLG 8715' - 8849' (134 FT, 14.9 FPH). Cum. wtr: $ 16,588

15:00 04:00 13.00 TRIP FOR BIT N°6, (SURVEY AT 8768' = 3°), cum.Fuei $ 33,687

04:00 6:00 2.00 WASH AND REAM8705' - 8817'. Cum. Bits: $ 67,500

Cum Rot: 327.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 73 460 8721'

UP = 215,000 lbs. DOWN = 80,000 lbs. ROTATING = 197,000 lbs. DEPTH 8849

BG GAS 120-160

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1010
CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS



oc x /TE So G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT¥s-an assu 6 35

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/3/2004 Days: 26

Depth: 9219' Prog: 370' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $ 2550 TMC: $ 38,773 TDC: $ $ 18,845 CWC: $ $ 930,541

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.8 Liner: 6 Bit #: 6 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 39 stroke; 10 SIN: 105619 Surf. Csg; $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 7/5 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" int. cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/9/14 Press: 1270 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,320

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 Dev: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2/ In: 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: TRACE Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2.0 FTG: 370 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,550

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 23 Separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.5 FPH: 16 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT; $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,550

DAP 5.1 wos: 10-25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Doun: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 18,845

06:00 06:30 0.50 WASH AND REAM8817 - 8849'. Cum. Wtr: $ 16,588

06:30 13:30 7.00 DRLG 8849' - 9008' (159 FT, 22.7 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 33,687

13:30 14:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Bits: $ 67,500

14:00 06:00 16.00 DRLG 9008' - 9219' (211 FT, 13.1 FPH). cumRot: 350.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N° 1 67 440 9135'

UP = 220,000 lbs. DOWN = 170,000 lbs, ROTATING = 200,000 lbs. DEPTH 9215

BG GAS 180-200

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1360

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS

oc x /TE So G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT¥s-an assu 6 35

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/3/2004 Days: 26

Depth: 9219' Prog: 370' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $ 2550 TMC: $ 38,773 TDC: $ $ 18,845 CWC: $ $ 930,541

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.8 Liner: 6 Bit #: 6 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 39 stroke; 10 SIN: 105619 Surf. Csg; $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 7/5 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" int. cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/9/14 Press: 1270 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,320

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 Dev: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2/ In: 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: TRACE Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2.0 FTG: 370 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,550

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 23 Separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.5 FPH: 16 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT; $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,550

DAP 5.1 wos: 10-25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Doun: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 18,845

06:00 06:30 0.50 WASH AND REAM8817 - 8849'. Cum. Wtr: $ 16,588

06:30 13:30 7.00 DRLG 8849' - 9008' (159 FT, 22.7 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 33,687

13:30 14:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Bits: $ 67,500

14:00 06:00 16.00 DRLG 9008' - 9219' (211 FT, 13.1 FPH). cumRot: 350.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N° 1 67 440 9135'

UP = 220,000 lbs. DOWN = 170,000 lbs, ROTATING = 200,000 lbs. DEPTH 9215

BG GAS 180-200

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1360

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS

oc x /TE So G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT¥s-an assu 6 35

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/3/2004 Days: 26

Depth: 9219' Prog: 370' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE
DMC: $ 2550 TMC: $ 38,773 TDC: $ $ 18,845 CWC: $ $ 930,541

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.8 Liner: 6 Bit #: 6 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 39 stroke; 10 SIN: 105619 Surf. Csg; $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 7/5 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" int. cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/9/14 Press: 1270 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,320

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 Dev: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2/ In: 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: TRACE Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2.0 FTG: 370 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,550

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 23 Separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.5 FPH: 16 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT; $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,550

DAP 5.1 wos: 10-25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Doun: RPM: 40-67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 18,845

06:00 06:30 0.50 WASH AND REAM8817 - 8849'. Cum. Wtr: $ 16,588

06:30 13:30 7.00 DRLG 8849' - 9008' (159 FT, 22.7 FPH). Cum. Fuel $ 33,687

13:30 14:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Bits: $ 67,500

14:00 06:00 16.00 DRLG 9008' - 9219' (211 FT, 13.1 FPH). cumRot: 350.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N° 1 67 440 9135'

UP = 220,000 lbs. DOWN = 170,000 lbs, ROTATING = 200,000 lbs. DEPTH 9215

BG GAS 180-200

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1360

CONSULTANT: J. DUNCAN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS



on xm s-aa GkO PRODUCTION COMPÑY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORTys-dW-ar3¥3 0 3 6

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/4/2004 Days: 27

Depth: 9439' KB Prog: 220' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MEASVERDE

DMC: $ 3089 TMC: $ TDC: $ $ 19,384 CWC: $ $ 949,925

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9 Liner: 6 Bit #: 6 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 37 Stroke: 10 SIN: 105619 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/6 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/13/18 Press: 1270 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,320

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 NV: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2.0 FTG: 220 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,550

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 23 Separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.6 FPH: 14 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,089

KCL: 5.4 WOB: 20-35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim Break Dot n: RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 19,384

06:00 13:00 7.00 DRLG 9219-9295', (76 FT, 10.8 FPH) cum. wtr: $ 16,588

13:00 13:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 33,687

13:30 02:30 16.00 DRLG 9295-9411', (116 FT, 7.3 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 67,500

2:30 3:00 0.50 ATTEMPT TO CLEAN BIT Rot. Hrs: 373.5

3:00 6:00 3.00 DRLG 9411-9439', (28 FT, 9.3 FPH)

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 66 500 9423

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 190,000 lbs. ROTATING = 200,000 lbs. DEPTH 9426

BG GAS 160-220

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 2020

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS

on xm s-aa GkO PRODUCTION COMPÑY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORTys-dW-ar3¥3 0 3 6

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/4/2004 Days: 27

Depth: 9439' KB Prog: 220' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MEASVERDE

DMC: $ 3089 TMC: $ TDC: $ $ 19,384 CWC: $ $ 949,925

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9 Liner: 6 Bit #: 6 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 37 Stroke: 10 SIN: 105619 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/6 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/13/18 Press: 1270 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,320

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 NV: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2.0 FTG: 220 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,550

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 23 Separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.6 FPH: 14 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,089

KCL: 5.4 WOB: 20-35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim Break Dot n: RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 19,384

06:00 13:00 7.00 DRLG 9219-9295', (76 FT, 10.8 FPH) cum. wtr: $ 16,588

13:00 13:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 33,687

13:30 02:30 16.00 DRLG 9295-9411', (116 FT, 7.3 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 67,500

2:30 3:00 0.50 ATTEMPT TO CLEAN BIT Rot. Hrs: 373.5

3:00 6:00 3.00 DRLG 9411-9439', (28 FT, 9.3 FPH)

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 66 500 9423

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 190,000 lbs. ROTATING = 200,000 lbs. DEPTH 9426

BG GAS 160-220

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 2020

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS

on xm s-aa GkO PRODUCTION COMPÑY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORTys-dW-ar3¥3 0 3 6

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/4/2004 Days: 27

Depth: 9439' KB Prog: 220' OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MEASVERDE

DMC: $ 3089 TMC: $ TDC: $ $ 19,384 CWC: $ $ 949,925

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9 Liner: 6 Bit #: 6 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 37 Stroke: 10 SIN: 105619 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/6 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/13/18 Press: 1270 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,320

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 NV: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2.0 FTG: 220 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,550

Chis: 15,000 Hrs: 23 Separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .5/5.6 FPH: 14 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,089

KCL: 5.4 WOB: 20-35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim Break Dot n: RPM: 50 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 19,384

06:00 13:00 7.00 DRLG 9219-9295', (76 FT, 10.8 FPH) cum. wtr: $ 16,588

13:00 13:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 33,687

13:30 02:30 16.00 DRLG 9295-9411', (116 FT, 7.3 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 67,500

2:30 3:00 0.50 ATTEMPT TO CLEAN BIT Rot. Hrs: 373.5

3:00 6:00 3.00 DRLG 9411-9439', (28 FT, 9.3 FPH)

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 66 500 9423

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 190,000 lbs. ROTATING = 200,000 lbs. DEPTH 9426

BG GAS 160-220

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 2020

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS



7'a13 /f/fr a sa G O PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/5/2004 Days: 28

Depth: 9615' KB Prog: 176 OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 4015 TMC: $ TDC: $ $ 31,035 CWC: $ $ 949,925

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.2 Liner: Bit #: 6 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 36 Stroke: SIN: 105619 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/8 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/14/19 Press: MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,320

ph: 9.0 GPM: Type: DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 8.8 NV: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 3.0 FTG: 176 Tanks; $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,550

Chls: 14,000 Hrs: 22 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .3/5.7 FPH: 8 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

CA: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,015

KCL: 5.3 wos: 20-35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim: Break Doun: RPM: 50-65 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 19,294

6:00 22:00 16.00 DRLG 9439-9579', (140 FT, 8.8 FPH) cum. wtr: $ 16,588

22:00 23:00 1.00 REPAIR ROGATING HEAD Cum. Fuel $ 44,412

23:00 05:00 6.00 DRLG 9579-9611', (32 FT, 5.3 FPH) cum.Bits: S 67,500

5:00 6:00 1.00 REPAIR ROGATING HEAD Rot. Hrs: 381.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 71 520 9579

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 180,000 Ibs. ROTATING = 203,000 lbs. DEPTH 9611

BG GAS 130-200

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1120

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS

7'a13 /f/fr a sa G O PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/5/2004 Days: 28

Depth: 9615' KB Prog: 176 OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 4015 TMC: $ TDC: $ $ 31,035 CWC: $ $ 949,925

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.2 Liner: Bit #: 6 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 36 Stroke: SIN: 105619 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/8 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/14/19 Press: MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,320

ph: 9.0 GPM: Type: DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 8.8 NV: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 3.0 FTG: 176 Tanks; $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,550

Chls: 14,000 Hrs: 22 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .3/5.7 FPH: 8 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

CA: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,015

KCL: 5.3 wos: 20-35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim: Break Doun: RPM: 50-65 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 19,294

6:00 22:00 16.00 DRLG 9439-9579', (140 FT, 8.8 FPH) cum. wtr: $ 16,588

22:00 23:00 1.00 REPAIR ROGATING HEAD Cum. Fuel $ 44,412

23:00 05:00 6.00 DRLG 9579-9611', (32 FT, 5.3 FPH) cum.Bits: S 67,500

5:00 6:00 1.00 REPAIR ROGATING HEAD Rot. Hrs: 381.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 71 520 9579

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 180,000 Ibs. ROTATING = 203,000 lbs. DEPTH 9611

BG GAS 130-200

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1120

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS

7'a13 /f/fr a sa G O PRODUCTION COMPAY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/5/2004 Days: 28

Depth: 9615' KB Prog: 176 OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 4015 TMC: $ TDC: $ $ 31,035 CWC: $ $ 949,925

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.2 Liner: Bit #: 6 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 36 Stroke: SIN: 105619 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/8 SPM: Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/14/19 Press: MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,320

ph: 9.0 GPM: Type: DSX146 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 8.8 NV: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 8849 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 3.0 FTG: 176 Tanks; $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,550

Chls: 14,000 Hrs: 22 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .3/5.7 FPH: 8 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

CA: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,015

KCL: 5.3 wos: 20-35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim: Break Doun: RPM: 50-65 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ -

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 19,294

6:00 22:00 16.00 DRLG 9439-9579', (140 FT, 8.8 FPH) cum. wtr: $ 16,588

22:00 23:00 1.00 REPAIR ROGATING HEAD Cum. Fuel $ 44,412

23:00 05:00 6.00 DRLG 9579-9611', (32 FT, 5.3 FPH) cum.Bits: S 67,500

5:00 6:00 1.00 REPAIR ROGATING HEAD Rot. Hrs: 381.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 71 520 9579

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 180,000 Ibs. ROTATING = 203,000 lbs. DEPTH 9611

BG GAS 130-200

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, DS, MUD MOTOR, IBS, SS, 1-6 3/8"" DC, IBS, 22 6-3/8" DC. CONN GAS 1120

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 771.94 TRIP GAS



p A/g S-o GkO PRODUCTION COMP YT' DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/6/04 Days: 29

Depth: 9615' KB Prog: 176 OPR: DRILLIN( Forrnation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 2906 TMC: $ 48,783 TDC: $ $ 17,986 CWC: $ $ 998,946

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 6 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 40 stroke: 10 SIN: 105619 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 10-Dec SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" Int. cag: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/15/23 Press: 1270 MFG: HYCALOG STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,105

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX146 MR45H Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 6.8 NV: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 18-Mar Well Head; $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 8849 9620 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

sand: 0.2 Dev: MISRUN out: 9620 Packers; $ - Bits I corehead: $ -

Solids: 3.0 FTG: 9 80 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 2 7.5 Separator; $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .6/6.8 FPH: 4.5 10.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

cA 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,906

DAP 5.7 WOB: 35 25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor $ -

Time Break DOL m: RPM: 45 45 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 58000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,986

6:00 8:00 2:00 DRLG 9611-9620', (9 FT, 4.5 FPH) cum.wtr: $ 16,588

8:00 13:00 5:00 POOH WI BIT Cum. Fuel $ 44,412

13:00 15:30 2:30 LD STAB., SS, DS, AND MOTOR. PU NEW MOTOR AND TRI CONE cum.Bits: $ 67,500

15:00 21:00 6:00 TIH WI BIT #7 Rot. Hrs: 381.5

21:00 22:30 1:30 WASH AND REAM 9507-9620', 113' TO BTM. NO FILL.

22:30 6:00 7.50 DRLG 9620-9700', (80 FT, 10.7 FPH)
0:00
0:00

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 70 620 9681

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 85,000 lbs. ROTATING = 203,000 lbs. TRIP GAS 1490

CONN 380

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 220
CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =

p A/g S-o GkO PRODUCTION COMP Y
T' DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/6/04 Days: 29

Depth: 9615' KB Prog: 176 OPR: DRILLIN( Forrnation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 2906 TMC: $ 48,783 TDC: $ $ 17,986 CWC: $ $ 998,946

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 6 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 40 stroke: 10 SIN: 105619 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 10-Dec SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" Int. cag: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/15/23 Press: 1270 MFG: HYCALOG STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,105

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX146 MR45H Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 6.8 NV: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 18-Mar Well Head; $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 8849 9620 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

sand: 0.2 Dev: MISRUN out: 9620 Packers; $ - Bits I corehead: $ -

Solids: 3.0 FTG: 9 80 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 2 7.5 Separator; $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .6/6.8 FPH: 4.5 10.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

cA 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,906

DAP 5.7 WOB: 35 25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor $ -

Time Break DOL m: RPM: 45 45 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 58000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,986

6:00 8:00 2:00 DRLG 9611-9620', (9 FT, 4.5 FPH) cum.wtr: $ 16,588

8:00 13:00 5:00 POOH WI BIT Cum. Fuel $ 44,412

13:00 15:30 2:30 LD STAB., SS, DS, AND MOTOR. PU NEW MOTOR AND TRI CONE cum.Bits: $ 67,500

15:00 21:00 6:00 TIH WI BIT #7 Rot. Hrs: 381.5

21:00 22:30 1:30 WASH AND REAM 9507-9620', 113' TO BTM. NO FILL.

22:30 6:00 7.50 DRLG 9620-9700', (80 FT, 10.7 FPH)
0:00
0:00

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 70 620 9681

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 85,000 lbs. ROTATING = 203,000 lbs. TRIP GAS 1490

CONN 380

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 220
CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =

p A/g S-o GkO PRODUCTION COMP Y
T' DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/6/04 Days: 29

Depth: 9615' KB Prog: 176 OPR: DRILLIN( Forrnation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 2906 TMC: $ 48,783 TDC: $ $ 17,986 CWC: $ $ 998,946

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRLD FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 6 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 40 stroke: 10 SIN: 105619 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 10-Dec SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" Int. cag: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 5/15/23 Press: 1270 MFG: HYCALOG STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,105

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: DSX146 MR45H Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 6.8 NV: Jets: 4-14, 3-18 18-Mar Well Head; $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 8849 9620 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

sand: 0.2 Dev: MISRUN out: 9620 Packers; $ - Bits I corehead: $ -

Solids: 3.0 FTG: 9 80 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 2 7.5 Separator; $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .6/6.8 FPH: 4.5 10.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

cA 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,906

DAP 5.7 WOB: 35 25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor $ -

Time Break DOL m: RPM: 45 45 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 58,000 58000 Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,986

6:00 8:00 2:00 DRLG 9611-9620', (9 FT, 4.5 FPH) cum.wtr: $ 16,588

8:00 13:00 5:00 POOH WI BIT Cum. Fuel $ 44,412

13:00 15:30 2:30 LD STAB., SS, DS, AND MOTOR. PU NEW MOTOR AND TRI CONE cum.Bits: $ 67,500

15:00 21:00 6:00 TIH WI BIT #7 Rot. Hrs: 381.5

21:00 22:30 1:30 WASH AND REAM 9507-9620', 113' TO BTM. NO FILL.

22:30 6:00 7.50 DRLG 9620-9700', (80 FT, 10.7 FPH)
0:00
0:00

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 70 620 9681

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 85,000 lbs. ROTATING = 203,000 lbs. TRIP GAS 1490

CONN 380

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 220
CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =



GkO PRODUCTION COMP YTo is / / f£ MF DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/7/2004 Days: 36

Depth: 9947' KB Prog: 332 OPR: DRILLINC Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 3109 TMC $ 51,892 TDC: $ $ 36,934 CWC: $ $ 1,035,880

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.4 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 36 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 8/7 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 6/14/23 Press: 1700 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,350

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger; $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 17,500

Solids: 3.0 FTG: 412 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 14,000 Hrs: 31 Separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .6/6.8 FPH: 13.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

CA 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,109

DAP 5.6 wos: 35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 36,934

06:00 15:30 9.50 DRLG 9700-9806', (106 FT, 11.4 FPH) cum.Wtr: $ 16,588

15:30 16:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 44,412

16:00 6:00 14.00 DRLG 9806-9947', (141 FT, 10 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 85,000

Rot. Hrs: 414.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 70 660 9745

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 199,000 lbs. ROTATING = 205,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN 2210

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 200-300

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =

GkO PRODUCTION COMP YTo is / / f£ MF DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/7/2004 Days: 36

Depth: 9947' KB Prog: 332 OPR: DRILLINC Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 3109 TMC $ 51,892 TDC: $ $ 36,934 CWC: $ $ 1,035,880

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.4 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 36 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 8/7 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 6/14/23 Press: 1700 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,350

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger; $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 17,500

Solids: 3.0 FTG: 412 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 14,000 Hrs: 31 Separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .6/6.8 FPH: 13.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

CA 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,109

DAP 5.6 wos: 35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 36,934

06:00 15:30 9.50 DRLG 9700-9806', (106 FT, 11.4 FPH) cum.Wtr: $ 16,588

15:30 16:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 44,412

16:00 6:00 14.00 DRLG 9806-9947', (141 FT, 10 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 85,000

Rot. Hrs: 414.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 70 660 9745

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 199,000 lbs. ROTATING = 205,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN 2210

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 200-300

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =

GkO PRODUCTION COMP YTo is / / f£ MF DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/7/2004 Days: 36

Depth: 9947' KB Prog: 332 OPR: DRILLINC Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 3109 TMC $ 51,892 TDC: $ $ 36,934 CWC: $ $ 1,035,880

Contractor: Mud Co: TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.4 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 36 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 8/7 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 6/14/23 Press: 1700 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,350

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger; $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 17,500

Solids: 3.0 FTG: 412 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 14,000 Hrs: 31 Separator: $ - Fuel: $ -

PflMf: .6/6.8 FPH: 13.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

CA 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,109

DAP 5.6 wos: 35 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 36,934

06:00 15:30 9.50 DRLG 9700-9806', (106 FT, 11.4 FPH) cum.Wtr: $ 16,588

15:30 16:00 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 44,412

16:00 6:00 14.00 DRLG 9806-9947', (141 FT, 10 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 85,000

Rot. Hrs: 414.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 70 660 9745

UP = 225,000 lbs. DOWN = 199,000 lbs. ROTATING = 205,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN 2210

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 200-300

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =



fS g ye se G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/8/2004 Days: 31

Depth: 10135' KB Prog: 188 OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 4517 TMC: $ 56,409 TDC: $ $ 33,805 CWC: $ $ 1,069,685

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 36 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 6/10 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 9/17/26 Press: 1740 MFG: STC Prod csg: S - BHA: $ 2,350

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods: $ - water: $ 2,963

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 10,000

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 600 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,420

chis: 14,000 Hrs: 54 5 separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/7.4 FPH: 11.0 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,517

Ca: 5.7 wos: 35/40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dorn: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 33,805

06:00 8:00 2.00 DRLG 9947-9966', (19 FT, 9.5 FPH) cum. wtr: S 19.551

8:00 8:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 44,412

8:30 6:00 21.50 DRLG 9966-10135', (169 FT, 7.8 FPH) cum.Bits: S 95,000

Rot. Hrs: 438

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 70 670 10060

UP - 230,000 lbs. DOWN = 190,000 lbs. ROTATING = 205,000 Ibs. TRIP GAS N/A

CONN 2350

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKGGAS 300400
CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =

fS g ye se G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/8/2004 Days: 31

Depth: 10135' KB Prog: 188 OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 4517 TMC: $ 56,409 TDC: $ $ 33,805 CWC: $ $ 1,069,685

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 36 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 6/10 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 9/17/26 Press: 1740 MFG: STC Prod csg: S - BHA: $ 2,350

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods: $ - water: $ 2,963

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 10,000

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 600 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,420

chis: 14,000 Hrs: 54 5 separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/7.4 FPH: 11.0 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,517

Ca: 5.7 wos: 35/40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dorn: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 33,805

06:00 8:00 2.00 DRLG 9947-9966', (19 FT, 9.5 FPH) cum. wtr: S 19.551

8:00 8:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 44,412

8:30 6:00 21.50 DRLG 9966-10135', (169 FT, 7.8 FPH) cum.Bits: S 95,000

Rot. Hrs: 438

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 70 670 10060

UP - 230,000 lbs. DOWN = 190,000 lbs. ROTATING = 205,000 Ibs. TRIP GAS N/A

CONN 2350

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKGGAS 300400
CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =

fS g ye se G O PRODUCTION COMP Y
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/8/2004 Days: 31

Depth: 10135' KB Prog: 188 OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 4517 TMC: $ 56,409 TDC: $ $ 33,805 CWC: $ $ 1,069,685

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.5 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

vis: 36 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 6/10 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 9/17/26 Press: 1740 MFG: STC Prod csg: S - BHA: $ 2,350

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 1/ AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods: $ - water: $ 2,963

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 10,000

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 600 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,420

chis: 14,000 Hrs: 54 5 separator: $ - corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/7.4 FPH: 11.0 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,517

Ca: 5.7 wos: 35/40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dorn: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 33,805

06:00 8:00 2.00 DRLG 9947-9966', (19 FT, 9.5 FPH) cum. wtr: S 19.551

8:00 8:30 0.50 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 44,412

8:30 6:00 21.50 DRLG 9966-10135', (169 FT, 7.8 FPH) cum.Bits: S 95,000

Rot. Hrs: 438

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 70 670 10060

UP - 230,000 lbs. DOWN = 190,000 lbs. ROTATING = 205,000 Ibs. TRIP GAS N/A

CONN 2350

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUD MOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKGGAS 300400
CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =



¥3mff-WW3 0 4 1
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/9/2004 Days: 32

Depth: 10381' KB Prog: 246 OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 3537 TMC: $ 59,946 TDC: $ $ 19,627 CWC: $ $ 1,089,547

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.6 Liner: 6 sit s: 7 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 36 stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 7/11 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 12/22/31 Press: 1740 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,115

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 20 NV: Jets: 3-18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake; 2 AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 761' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 78 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.5 FPH: 9.8 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,537

ca: 5.5 wos: 35/40 Prime Mover: $ - Wireline $ -

Tim Break Dov n: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 19,627

06:00 7:00 1.00 DRLG 10135-10136', (1 FT, 1 FPH) cum.wtr: S 19,551

7:00 7:30 0.50 BUILDPlLLAND PREPARE TO TRIP. REPAIR WEIGHT IND. Cum. Fuel $ 44,412

7:30 6:00 22.50 DRLG 10136-10381', 245 FT, 10.9 FPH) cum.Bits: S 95,000

Rot. Hrs: 461.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 69 660 10184

UP = 245,000 lbs. DOWN = 205,000 lbs. ROTATING = 210,000 lbs. TRIP GAS N/A

CONN 4120

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 700-1000

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =

¥3mff-WW3 0 4 1
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/9/2004 Days: 32

Depth: 10381' KB Prog: 246 OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 3537 TMC: $ 59,946 TDC: $ $ 19,627 CWC: $ $ 1,089,547

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.6 Liner: 6 sit s: 7 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 36 stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 7/11 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 12/22/31 Press: 1740 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,115

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 20 NV: Jets: 3-18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake; 2 AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 761' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 78 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.5 FPH: 9.8 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,537

ca: 5.5 wos: 35/40 Prime Mover: $ - Wireline $ -

Tim Break Dov n: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 19,627

06:00 7:00 1.00 DRLG 10135-10136', (1 FT, 1 FPH) cum.wtr: S 19,551

7:00 7:30 0.50 BUILDPlLLAND PREPARE TO TRIP. REPAIR WEIGHT IND. Cum. Fuel $ 44,412

7:30 6:00 22.50 DRLG 10136-10381', 245 FT, 10.9 FPH) cum.Bits: S 95,000

Rot. Hrs: 461.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 69 660 10184

UP = 245,000 lbs. DOWN = 205,000 lbs. ROTATING = 210,000 lbs. TRIP GAS N/A

CONN 4120

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 700-1000

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =

¥3mff-WW3 0 4 1
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/9/2004 Days: 32

Depth: 10381' KB Prog: 246 OPR: DRILLIN( Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 3537 TMC: $ 59,946 TDC: $ $ 19,627 CWC: $ $ 1,089,547

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MI DRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.6 Liner: 6 sit s: 7 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 36 stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 7/11 SPM: 120 size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 12/22/31 Press: 1740 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,115

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 20 NV: Jets: 3-18 wellHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake; 2 AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 761' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 78 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.5 FPH: 9.8 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,537

ca: 5.5 wos: 35/40 Prime Mover: $ - Wireline $ -

Tim Break Dov n: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 19,627

06:00 7:00 1.00 DRLG 10135-10136', (1 FT, 1 FPH) cum.wtr: S 19,551

7:00 7:30 0.50 BUILDPlLLAND PREPARE TO TRIP. REPAIR WEIGHT IND. Cum. Fuel $ 44,412

7:30 6:00 22.50 DRLG 10136-10381', 245 FT, 10.9 FPH) cum.Bits: S 95,000

Rot. Hrs: 461.5

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 69 660 10184

UP = 245,000 lbs. DOWN = 205,000 lbs. ROTATING = 210,000 lbs. TRIP GAS N/A

CONN 4120

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 700-1000

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =



- 044 g
7'ofs //fx Em GÊCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/10/2004 Days: 33

Depth: 10531' KB Prog: 150 OPR: POOH FOR NEW BIT Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 1958 TMC: $ 61,904 TDC: $ $ 24,833 CWC: $ $ 1,106,880

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.6 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 37 Stroke: 10 s/N: MT6004 Surf. Csg; $ - LOCatlOn: $ -

PvlYP: 7/11 SPM: 120 Size:
.

7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 15/26/35 Press: 1900 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,400

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 26 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: S 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out; Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 1061' Tanks; $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 93.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PffMf: .4/6.9 FPH: 11.3 Heater: S - consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,958

ca: 5.7 wos: 35/40 Prime Mover: $ - Wireline $ -

Tim i Break Dov n: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 24,833

06:00 15:00 9 DRLG 10381-10505', (124 FT, 9.5 FPH) cum.wtr: S 19,551

15:00 15:30 0.5 RIG SERV, FUNCTION PR, HCR, AND CK CROWNOMATIC. cum.Fuel $ 44,412

15:30 22:00 6.5 DRLG 10505-1031', (26 FT, 4 FPH) cum.Bits: 5 102,500

22:00 23:00 1 MIXAND PUMP PILL ROt. Hrs: 477

23:00 1:00 2 POOH FOR BIT#8

1:00 2:00 1 REPAIR SLIPS
2:00 6:00 4 POOH FOR BIT#8

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 71 670 10504

UP = 250,000 Ibs. DOWN = 205,000 lbs. ROTATING = 220,000 lbs. TRIP GAS N/A

CONN 2590

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 80-150

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =
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DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/10/2004 Days: 33

Depth: 10531' KB Prog: 150 OPR: POOH FOR NEW BIT Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 1958 TMC: $ 61,904 TDC: $ $ 24,833 CWC: $ $ 1,106,880

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.6 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 37 Stroke: 10 s/N: MT6004 Surf. Csg; $ - LOCatlOn: $ -

PvlYP: 7/11 SPM: 120 Size:
.

7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 15/26/35 Press: 1900 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,400

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 26 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: S 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out; Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 1061' Tanks; $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 93.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PffMf: .4/6.9 FPH: 11.3 Heater: S - consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,958

ca: 5.7 wos: 35/40 Prime Mover: $ - Wireline $ -

Tim i Break Dov n: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 24,833

06:00 15:00 9 DRLG 10381-10505', (124 FT, 9.5 FPH) cum.wtr: S 19,551

15:00 15:30 0.5 RIG SERV, FUNCTION PR, HCR, AND CK CROWNOMATIC. cum.Fuel $ 44,412

15:30 22:00 6.5 DRLG 10505-1031', (26 FT, 4 FPH) cum.Bits: 5 102,500

22:00 23:00 1 MIXAND PUMP PILL ROt. Hrs: 477

23:00 1:00 2 POOH FOR BIT#8

1:00 2:00 1 REPAIR SLIPS
2:00 6:00 4 POOH FOR BIT#8

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 71 670 10504

UP = 250,000 Ibs. DOWN = 205,000 lbs. ROTATING = 220,000 lbs. TRIP GAS N/A

CONN 2590

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 80-150

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =
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DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/10/2004 Days: 33

Depth: 10531' KB Prog: 150 OPR: POOH FOR NEW BIT Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 1958 TMC: $ 61,904 TDC: $ $ 24,833 CWC: $ $ 1,106,880

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.6 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 37 Stroke: 10 s/N: MT6004 Surf. Csg; $ - LOCatlOn: $ -

PvlYP: 7/11 SPM: 120 Size:
.

7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 15/26/35 Press: 1900 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,400

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type: MR45H Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 26 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: S 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 9620 TBGIRods; $ - Water: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out; Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 1061' Tanks; $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 93.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PffMf: .4/6.9 FPH: 11.3 Heater: S - consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,958

ca: 5.7 wos: 35/40 Prime Mover: $ - Wireline $ -

Tim i Break Dov n: RPM: 45 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 24,833

06:00 15:00 9 DRLG 10381-10505', (124 FT, 9.5 FPH) cum.wtr: S 19,551

15:00 15:30 0.5 RIG SERV, FUNCTION PR, HCR, AND CK CROWNOMATIC. cum.Fuel $ 44,412

15:30 22:00 6.5 DRLG 10505-1031', (26 FT, 4 FPH) cum.Bits: 5 102,500

22:00 23:00 1 MIXAND PUMP PILL ROt. Hrs: 477

23:00 1:00 2 POOH FOR BIT#8

1:00 2:00 1 REPAIR SLIPS
2:00 6:00 4 POOH FOR BIT#8

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 71 670 10504

UP = 250,000 Ibs. DOWN = 205,000 lbs. ROTATING = 220,000 lbs. TRIP GAS N/A

CONN 2590

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 80-150

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =



nu <itssŠ'GÊCO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/11/2004 Days: 34

Depth: 10611' KB Prog: 80 OPR: DRILLINGAI·EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMc: $ 1441.37 TMC: $ 63,345 TDC: $ $ 31,755 CWC: $ $ 1,138,635

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.8 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 8 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 38 stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 103281 Surt cog: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 8/12 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 13/25/34 Press: 1900 MFG: STC HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,785

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type; MR45H DSX49DGV Float Equp: $ - Coment: $ -

WL: 25 NV: Jets: 3-18 3-14/3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 9620 10531 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ 7,054

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: 10531 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 1061' 80' Tanks: S - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 93.5 12.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.9 FPH: 11.3 6.4 Heater; $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,441

ca: 5.8 wos: 20/25 10/20 Prime Mover: S - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim i Break Down: RPM: 30 30 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: S 31,755

06:00 8:00 2 LD MMAND BIT#7. PU MMAND BIT#8 cum.wtr: $ 19,551

8:00 10:00 2.0 TIH TO 3510'. cum.Fuei $ 58,520

10:00 12:30 2.5 SLIP 120' OF DRLG LINE. cum.Bits: S 110,000

12:30 17:00 4.5 FIN TIH FILLINGPIPE AT 5155' AND 9158'. Cum. Rot. Mrs

17:00 17:30 0.5 WASH 140' TO BTM, NO FILL.
17:30 6:00 12.5 DRLG 10531-10611', (80 FT, 6.4 FPH)

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 65 600 10536

UP = 255,000 lbs. DOWN = 200,000 lbs. ROTATING = 220,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =

nu <itssŠ'GÊCO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/11/2004 Days: 34

Depth: 10611' KB Prog: 80 OPR: DRILLINGAI·EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMc: $ 1441.37 TMC: $ 63,345 TDC: $ $ 31,755 CWC: $ $ 1,138,635

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.8 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 8 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 38 stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 103281 Surt cog: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 8/12 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 13/25/34 Press: 1900 MFG: STC HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,785

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type; MR45H DSX49DGV Float Equp: $ - Coment: $ -

WL: 25 NV: Jets: 3-18 3-14/3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 9620 10531 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ 7,054

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: 10531 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 1061' 80' Tanks: S - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 93.5 12.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.9 FPH: 11.3 6.4 Heater; $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,441

ca: 5.8 wos: 20/25 10/20 Prime Mover: S - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim i Break Down: RPM: 30 30 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: S 31,755

06:00 8:00 2 LD MMAND BIT#7. PU MMAND BIT#8 cum.wtr: $ 19,551

8:00 10:00 2.0 TIH TO 3510'. cum.Fuei $ 58,520

10:00 12:30 2.5 SLIP 120' OF DRLG LINE. cum.Bits: S 110,000

12:30 17:00 4.5 FIN TIH FILLINGPIPE AT 5155' AND 9158'. Cum. Rot. Mrs

17:00 17:30 0.5 WASH 140' TO BTM, NO FILL.
17:30 6:00 12.5 DRLG 10531-10611', (80 FT, 6.4 FPH)

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 65 600 10536

UP = 255,000 lbs. DOWN = 200,000 lbs. ROTATING = 220,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =

nu <itssŠ'GÊCO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/11/2004 Days: 34

Depth: 10611' KB Prog: 80 OPR: DRILLINGAI·EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMc: $ 1441.37 TMC: $ 63,345 TDC: $ $ 31,755 CWC: $ $ 1,138,635

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.8 Liner: 6 Bit #: 7 8 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 38 stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 103281 Surt cog: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 8/12 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 13/25/34 Press: 1900 MFG: STC HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,785

ph: 9.0 GPM: 418 Type; MR45H DSX49DGV Float Equp: $ - Coment: $ -

WL: 25 NV: Jets: 3-18 3-14/3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 9620 10531 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ 7,054

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: 10531 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,500

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 1061' 80' Tanks: S - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 93.5 12.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/6.9 FPH: 11.3 6.4 Heater; $ - consultant: $ 850

LCM: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,441

ca: 5.8 wos: 20/25 10/20 Prime Mover: S - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim i Break Down: RPM: 30 30 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: S 31,755

06:00 8:00 2 LD MMAND BIT#7. PU MMAND BIT#8 cum.wtr: $ 19,551

8:00 10:00 2.0 TIH TO 3510'. cum.Fuei $ 58,520

10:00 12:30 2.5 SLIP 120' OF DRLG LINE. cum.Bits: S 110,000

12:30 17:00 4.5 FIN TIH FILLINGPIPE AT 5155' AND 9158'. Cum. Rot. Mrs

17:00 17:30 0.5 WASH 140' TO BTM, NO FILL.
17:30 6:00 12.5 DRLG 10531-10611', (80 FT, 6.4 FPH)

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 65 600 10536

UP = 255,000 lbs. DOWN = 200,000 lbs. ROTATING = 220,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN
BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS
CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length =
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GÊCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/12/2004 Days: 35
Depth: 10688' KB Prog: 77 OPR: CHANGE OUT BHA Formation: MESAVERDE

DMc: $ 1538 TMC: $ 64,883 TDC: $ $ 17,013 CWC: $ $ 1,155,648

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.7 Liner: 6 Bit #: 8 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 35 Stroke: 10 s/N: 103281 surf.csg: S - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 5/10 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 12/26/33 Press: 1550 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,500

ph: 9.5 GPM: 400 Type: DSX49DGV Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 25 NV: Jets: 3-14/3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: S 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 10531 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $
Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: 10688 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 157' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 27.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .6/7.4 FPH: 5.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 100 TIBIG; Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,538

ca: 6.2 WOB: 10/25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim i Break Dov n: RPM: 30 Misc: S - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,013

06:00 8:00 2 DRLG 10611-10625', (14 FT, 7.0 FPH) cum.wtr: S 19,551

8:00 10:30 2.5 REPAIR #1 PUMP Cum. Fuel $ 58,520

10:30 23:30 13.0 DRLG 10625'-10688', (63 FT, 4.8 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 110,000

23:30 5:00 5.5 PUMPED PILLAND POOH FOR BIT#9. Cum. Rot. Hrs

5:00 6:00 1 LD BIT#8 AND MMAND PU BIT#9 AND NEW MM.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N° 2 66 540 10664

UP = 255,000 lbs. DOWN = 210,000 lbs. ROTATING = 225,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN 3000
BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 800-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME

04e O
GÊCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/12/2004 Days: 35
Depth: 10688' KB Prog: 77 OPR: CHANGE OUT BHA Formation: MESAVERDE

DMc: $ 1538 TMC: $ 64,883 TDC: $ $ 17,013 CWC: $ $ 1,155,648

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.7 Liner: 6 Bit #: 8 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 35 Stroke: 10 s/N: 103281 surf.csg: S - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 5/10 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 12/26/33 Press: 1550 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,500

ph: 9.5 GPM: 400 Type: DSX49DGV Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 25 NV: Jets: 3-14/3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: S 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 10531 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $
Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: 10688 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 157' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 27.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .6/7.4 FPH: 5.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 100 TIBIG; Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,538

ca: 6.2 WOB: 10/25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim i Break Dov n: RPM: 30 Misc: S - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,013

06:00 8:00 2 DRLG 10611-10625', (14 FT, 7.0 FPH) cum.wtr: S 19,551

8:00 10:30 2.5 REPAIR #1 PUMP Cum. Fuel $ 58,520

10:30 23:30 13.0 DRLG 10625'-10688', (63 FT, 4.8 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 110,000

23:30 5:00 5.5 PUMPED PILLAND POOH FOR BIT#9. Cum. Rot. Hrs

5:00 6:00 1 LD BIT#8 AND MMAND PU BIT#9 AND NEW MM.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N° 2 66 540 10664

UP = 255,000 lbs. DOWN = 210,000 lbs. ROTATING = 225,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN 3000
BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 800-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME

04e O
GÊCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/12/2004 Days: 35
Depth: 10688' KB Prog: 77 OPR: CHANGE OUT BHA Formation: MESAVERDE

DMc: $ 1538 TMC: $ 64,883 TDC: $ $ 17,013 CWC: $ $ 1,155,648

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.7 Liner: 6 Bit #: 8 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 35 Stroke: 10 s/N: 103281 surf.csg: S - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 5/10 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 12/26/33 Press: 1550 MFG: HYCALOG Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,500

ph: 9.5 GPM: 400 Type: DSX49DGV Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 25 NV: Jets: 3-14/3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: S 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 10531 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $
Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: 10688 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 157' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 27.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .6/7.4 FPH: 5.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

LCM: 100 TIBIG; Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,538

ca: 6.2 WOB: 10/25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim i Break Dov n: RPM: 30 Misc: S - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 17,013

06:00 8:00 2 DRLG 10611-10625', (14 FT, 7.0 FPH) cum.wtr: S 19,551

8:00 10:30 2.5 REPAIR #1 PUMP Cum. Fuel $ 58,520

10:30 23:30 13.0 DRLG 10625'-10688', (63 FT, 4.8 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 110,000

23:30 5:00 5.5 PUMPED PILLAND POOH FOR BIT#9. Cum. Rot. Hrs

5:00 6:00 1 LD BIT#8 AND MMAND PU BIT#9 AND NEW MM.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N° 2 66 540 10664

UP = 255,000 lbs. DOWN = 210,000 lbs. ROTATING = 225,000 lbs. TRIP GAS

CONN 3000
BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS 800-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME



09 /'7/" S se GÊCO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/13/2004 Days: 36
Depth: 10802' KB Prog: 114 OPR: DRILLINGAI· ¯AD

Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 561 TMC: $ 65,444 TDC: $ $ 23,036 CWC: $ $ 1,171,884

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.7 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 37 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf, Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 8/8 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 17/24/30 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,700

ph: 9.0 GPM: 420 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 22 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 6,800

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 114' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools; S 1,420

Chis: 13,000 Hrs: 17 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .5/6.4 FPH: 6.7 Heater: $ - consultant: S 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 561

DAP 6.2 wos: 35/45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim aBreak Dov n: RPM: 65/67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 23,036

06:00 6:30 0.5 FINISH PU BHA. cum.wtr: S 19,551

6:30 13:00 6.5 TIH FILLINGPIPE AT 4254 &9715. FUNCT. TEST AFTER TRIP Cum. Fuel $ 58,520

10:30 23:30 17.0 DRLG 10688'-10802', (114 FT, 6.7 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 116,800

Cum. Rot. Hrs

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 66 560 10728

UP = 250,000 lbs. DOWN = 205,000 lbs. ROTATING = 225,000 lbs. TRIP GAS: 4860

CONN: 2300
BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 600-1900

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME:

09 /'7/" S se GÊCO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/13/2004 Days: 36
Depth: 10802' KB Prog: 114 OPR: DRILLINGAI· ¯AD

Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 561 TMC: $ 65,444 TDC: $ $ 23,036 CWC: $ $ 1,171,884

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.7 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 37 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf, Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 8/8 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 17/24/30 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,700

ph: 9.0 GPM: 420 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 22 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 6,800

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 114' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools; S 1,420

Chis: 13,000 Hrs: 17 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .5/6.4 FPH: 6.7 Heater: $ - consultant: S 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 561

DAP 6.2 wos: 35/45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim aBreak Dov n: RPM: 65/67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 23,036

06:00 6:30 0.5 FINISH PU BHA. cum.wtr: S 19,551

6:30 13:00 6.5 TIH FILLINGPIPE AT 4254 &9715. FUNCT. TEST AFTER TRIP Cum. Fuel $ 58,520

10:30 23:30 17.0 DRLG 10688'-10802', (114 FT, 6.7 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 116,800

Cum. Rot. Hrs

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 66 560 10728

UP = 250,000 lbs. DOWN = 205,000 lbs. ROTATING = 225,000 lbs. TRIP GAS: 4860

CONN: 2300
BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 600-1900

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME:

09 /'7/" S se GÊCO PRODUCTION COMP NY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/13/2004 Days: 36
Depth: 10802' KB Prog: 114 OPR: DRILLINGAI· ¯AD

Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 561 TMC: $ 65,444 TDC: $ $ 23,036 CWC: $ $ 1,171,884

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.7 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 37 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf, Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 8/8 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 17/24/30 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,700

ph: 9.0 GPM: 420 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 22 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 6,800

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 114' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools; S 1,420

Chis: 13,000 Hrs: 17 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .5/6.4 FPH: 6.7 Heater: $ - consultant: S 850

ca: 120 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 561

DAP 6.2 wos: 35/45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim aBreak Dov n: RPM: 65/67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 23,036

06:00 6:30 0.5 FINISH PU BHA. cum.wtr: S 19,551

6:30 13:00 6.5 TIH FILLINGPIPE AT 4254 &9715. FUNCT. TEST AFTER TRIP Cum. Fuel $ 58,520

10:30 23:30 17.0 DRLG 10688'-10802', (114 FT, 6.7 FPH) cum.Bits: $ 116,800

Cum. Rot. Hrs

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 66 560 10728

UP = 250,000 lbs. DOWN = 205,000 lbs. ROTATING = 225,000 lbs. TRIP GAS: 4860

CONN: 2300
BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 600-1900

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME:



4 8
GÊCO PRODUCTION COMP IY

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9WE/2004Days: Kjf
Depth: 10952' KB Prog: 150 OPR: DRILLINGAE EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMc: $ 639 TMC: $ 66,083 Toc: $ $ 16,964 Cwc: $ $ 1,188,848

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.7 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 35 Stroke; 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 6/11 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: S 10,800

Gel: 12/23/31 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod csg: $ - BHA: S 2,350

ph: 9.0 GPM: 420 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 24 NV: Jets: 3-18 Weil Head; $ - Mud Logger; $ 775

Cake: 1 AV: In: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 264' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 13,000 Hrs: 40.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/7.2 FPH: 6.5 Heater: S - consultant: $ 850

Ca: 100 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 639

DAP 6.2 WOB: 35/45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim : Break Dov n: RPM: 65/67 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,964

06:00 14:00 8.0 DRLG 10802'-10859', (57 FT, 7.1 FPH) cum.wtr; $ 19,551

14:00 14:30 0.5 REPAIR LIGHTPLANT Cum. Fuel $ 58,520

14:30 6:00 15.5 DRLG 10859'-10962', (103 FT, 6.6 FPH) cum.Bits: S 116,800

Cum. Rot. Hr:

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 66 600 10888

UP = 255,000 lbs. DOWN = 210,000 lbs. ROTATING = 237,000 lbs. TRIP GAS: 0

CONN: 2670

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 1500-2000

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME:

4 8
GÊCO PRODUCTION COMP IY

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9WE/2004Days: Kjf
Depth: 10952' KB Prog: 150 OPR: DRILLINGAE EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMc: $ 639 TMC: $ 66,083 Toc: $ $ 16,964 Cwc: $ $ 1,188,848

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.7 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 35 Stroke; 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 6/11 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: S 10,800

Gel: 12/23/31 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod csg: $ - BHA: S 2,350

ph: 9.0 GPM: 420 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 24 NV: Jets: 3-18 Weil Head; $ - Mud Logger; $ 775

Cake: 1 AV: In: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 264' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 13,000 Hrs: 40.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/7.2 FPH: 6.5 Heater: S - consultant: $ 850

Ca: 100 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 639

DAP 6.2 WOB: 35/45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim : Break Dov n: RPM: 65/67 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,964

06:00 14:00 8.0 DRLG 10802'-10859', (57 FT, 7.1 FPH) cum.wtr; $ 19,551

14:00 14:30 0.5 REPAIR LIGHTPLANT Cum. Fuel $ 58,520

14:30 6:00 15.5 DRLG 10859'-10962', (103 FT, 6.6 FPH) cum.Bits: S 116,800

Cum. Rot. Hr:

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 66 600 10888

UP = 255,000 lbs. DOWN = 210,000 lbs. ROTATING = 237,000 lbs. TRIP GAS: 0

CONN: 2670

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 1500-2000

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME:

4 8
GÊCO PRODUCTION COMP IY

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9WE/2004Days: Kjf
Depth: 10952' KB Prog: 150 OPR: DRILLINGAE EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMc: $ 639 TMC: $ 66,083 Toc: $ $ 16,964 Cwc: $ $ 1,188,848

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRLC FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.7 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 35 Stroke; 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: 6/11 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: S 10,800

Gel: 12/23/31 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod csg: $ - BHA: S 2,350

ph: 9.0 GPM: 420 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 24 NV: Jets: 3-18 Weil Head; $ - Mud Logger; $ 775

Cake: 1 AV: In: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ -

Sand: 0.2 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 264' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 13,000 Hrs: 40.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/7.2 FPH: 6.5 Heater: S - consultant: $ 850

Ca: 100 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 639

DAP 6.2 WOB: 35/45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim : Break Dov n: RPM: 65/67 Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,964

06:00 14:00 8.0 DRLG 10802'-10859', (57 FT, 7.1 FPH) cum.wtr; $ 19,551

14:00 14:30 0.5 REPAIR LIGHTPLANT Cum. Fuel $ 58,520

14:30 6:00 15.5 DRLG 10859'-10962', (103 FT, 6.6 FPH) cum.Bits: S 116,800

Cum. Rot. Hr:

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 66 600 10888

UP = 255,000 lbs. DOWN = 210,000 lbs. ROTATING = 237,000 lbs. TRIP GAS: 0

CONN: 2670

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 1500-2000

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME:



DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/15/2004 Days: 38

Depth: 11217' KB Prog: 119 OPR: DRILLINGAl·EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 2223 TMc: $ 71,509 TDC: $ $ 18,498 cwc: $ $ 1,235,572

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.9 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 51 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 15/13 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 8/14/21 Press: 1980 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,300

ph: 9.0 GPM: 400 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Coment: $ -

WL: 16 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: in: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - Water/Fuel: $ -

Sand: 0.5 Dev: Out: Packers; $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 529' Tanks: S - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 87.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PfiMf: .4/S.7 FPH: 6.0 Heater: $ - consultant: S 850

ca: 100 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,223

DAP 5.3 WOB: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim : Break Dov n: RPM: 45/64 MIsc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 18,498

06:00 8:30 2.5 DRLG 11098'-11110', (12 FT, 4.8 FPH) cum.wtr: S 21,389

8:30 9:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, FUNTIONTEST PR, HCR, AND CROWNSAVER cum.Fuel S 58,520

9:00 24:00:00 14.5 DRLG 11110'-11191', (81 FT, 5.6 FPH) cum.Bits: S 123,600

24:00:00 0:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, FUNTIONTEST PR, HCR, AND CROWNSAVER Cum. Rot. Hra

0:30 6:00 6.0 DRLG 11191'-11217', (26 FT, 4.3 FPH)

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 69 720 11174

UP = 250,000 lbs. DOWN = 210,000 lbs. ROTATING = 230,000 lbs. TRIP GAS: 0

CONN: 2240

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 1000-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME:

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/15/2004 Days: 38

Depth: 11217' KB Prog: 119 OPR: DRILLINGAl·EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 2223 TMc: $ 71,509 TDC: $ $ 18,498 cwc: $ $ 1,235,572

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.9 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 51 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 15/13 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 8/14/21 Press: 1980 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,300

ph: 9.0 GPM: 400 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Coment: $ -

WL: 16 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: in: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - Water/Fuel: $ -

Sand: 0.5 Dev: Out: Packers; $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 529' Tanks: S - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 87.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PfiMf: .4/S.7 FPH: 6.0 Heater: $ - consultant: S 850

ca: 100 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,223

DAP 5.3 WOB: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim : Break Dov n: RPM: 45/64 MIsc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 18,498

06:00 8:30 2.5 DRLG 11098'-11110', (12 FT, 4.8 FPH) cum.wtr: S 21,389

8:30 9:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, FUNTIONTEST PR, HCR, AND CROWNSAVER cum.Fuel S 58,520

9:00 24:00:00 14.5 DRLG 11110'-11191', (81 FT, 5.6 FPH) cum.Bits: S 123,600

24:00:00 0:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, FUNTIONTEST PR, HCR, AND CROWNSAVER Cum. Rot. Hra

0:30 6:00 6.0 DRLG 11191'-11217', (26 FT, 4.3 FPH)

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 69 720 11174

UP = 250,000 lbs. DOWN = 210,000 lbs. ROTATING = 230,000 lbs. TRIP GAS: 0

CONN: 2240

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 1000-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME:

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/15/2004 Days: 38

Depth: 11217' KB Prog: 119 OPR: DRILLINGAl·EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 2223 TMc: $ 71,509 TDC: $ $ 18,498 cwc: $ $ 1,235,572

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.9 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 51 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 15/13 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 8/14/21 Press: 1980 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 2,300

ph: 9.0 GPM: 400 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Coment: $ -

WL: 16 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: in: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - Water/Fuel: $ -

Sand: 0.5 Dev: Out: Packers; $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 529' Tanks: S - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 14,000 Hrs: 87.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PfiMf: .4/S.7 FPH: 6.0 Heater: $ - consultant: S 850

ca: 100 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,223

DAP 5.3 WOB: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim : Break Dov n: RPM: 45/64 MIsc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 18,498

06:00 8:30 2.5 DRLG 11098'-11110', (12 FT, 4.8 FPH) cum.wtr: S 21,389

8:30 9:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE, FUNTIONTEST PR, HCR, AND CROWNSAVER cum.Fuel S 58,520

9:00 24:00:00 14.5 DRLG 11110'-11191', (81 FT, 5.6 FPH) cum.Bits: S 123,600

24:00:00 0:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE, FUNTIONTEST PR, HCR, AND CROWNSAVER Cum. Rot. Hra

0:30 6:00 6.0 DRLG 11191'-11217', (26 FT, 4.3 FPH)

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°1 69 720 11174

UP = 250,000 lbs. DOWN = 210,000 lbs. ROTATING = 230,000 lbs. TRIP GAS: 0

CONN: 2240

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 1000-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN TIME:



DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/16/2004 Days: 39

Depth: 11310' KB Prog: 93 OPR: DRILLINGAl-EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 1439 TMc: $ 72,948 TDC: $ $ 24,943 CWC: $ $ 1,260,515

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.9 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 57 stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 13/14 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 8/16/24 Press: 1980 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,650

ph: 9.0 GPM: 420 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Coment: $ -

WL: 15.6 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: S 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - water/Fuel: $ 7,184

Sand: 0.6 Dev: out: 11310 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 622' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 14,000 Hrs: 104 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/4.8 FPH: 6 0 Heater: $ - consultant: S 850

Ca: 100 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,439

DAP 5.3 WOB: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: S 695

Tim Break Dov n: RPM: 65/67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 24,943

06:00 22:30 16.5 DRLG 1121T-11310', (93 FT, 5.6 FPH) cum.wtr: S 21,389

22:30 24:00:00 1.5 MIXPlLL Cum. Fuel $ 65,704

0:00 0:30:00 0.5 PUMP PILLAND DROPPED SURVEY cum.Bits: $ 123,600

0:30:00 6:00 5.5 POOH FOR BIT#10 INCOMPLETE. Cum. Rot. Hr!

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 72 980 11302

UP = 250,000 lbs. DOWN = 220,000 lbs. ROTATING = 230,000 Ibs. TRIP GAS: 0

CONN: 1830

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKGGAS: 1000-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWNTIME:

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/16/2004 Days: 39

Depth: 11310' KB Prog: 93 OPR: DRILLINGAl-EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 1439 TMc: $ 72,948 TDC: $ $ 24,943 CWC: $ $ 1,260,515

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.9 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 57 stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 13/14 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 8/16/24 Press: 1980 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,650

ph: 9.0 GPM: 420 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Coment: $ -

WL: 15.6 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: S 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - water/Fuel: $ 7,184

Sand: 0.6 Dev: out: 11310 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 622' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 14,000 Hrs: 104 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/4.8 FPH: 6 0 Heater: $ - consultant: S 850

Ca: 100 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,439

DAP 5.3 WOB: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: S 695

Tim Break Dov n: RPM: 65/67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 24,943

06:00 22:30 16.5 DRLG 1121T-11310', (93 FT, 5.6 FPH) cum.wtr: S 21,389

22:30 24:00:00 1.5 MIXPlLL Cum. Fuel $ 65,704

0:00 0:30:00 0.5 PUMP PILLAND DROPPED SURVEY cum.Bits: $ 123,600

0:30:00 6:00 5.5 POOH FOR BIT#10 INCOMPLETE. Cum. Rot. Hr!

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 72 980 11302

UP = 250,000 lbs. DOWN = 220,000 lbs. ROTATING = 230,000 Ibs. TRIP GAS: 0

CONN: 1830

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKGGAS: 1000-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWNTIME:

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/16/2004 Days: 39

Depth: 11310' KB Prog: 93 OPR: DRILLINGAl-EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 1439 TMc: $ 72,948 TDC: $ $ 24,943 CWC: $ $ 1,260,515

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 9.9 Liner: 6 Bit #: 9 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 57 stroke: 10 SIN: MT6004 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 13/14 SPM: 120 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 8/16/24 Press: 1980 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ 1,650

ph: 9.0 GPM: 420 Type: MF45H Float Equp: $ - Coment: $ -

WL: 15.6 NV: Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: S 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 10688 TBGIRods: $ - water/Fuel: $ 7,184

Sand: 0.6 Dev: out: 11310 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 4.0 FTG: 622' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 14,000 Hrs: 104 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/4.8 FPH: 6 0 Heater: $ - consultant: S 850

Ca: 100 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,439

DAP 5.3 WOB: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: S 695

Tim Break Dov n: RPM: 65/67 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 24,943

06:00 22:30 16.5 DRLG 1121T-11310', (93 FT, 5.6 FPH) cum.wtr: S 21,389

22:30 24:00:00 1.5 MIXPlLL Cum. Fuel $ 65,704

0:00 0:30:00 0.5 PUMP PILLAND DROPPED SURVEY cum.Bits: $ 123,600

0:30:00 6:00 5.5 POOH FOR BIT#10 INCOMPLETE. Cum. Rot. Hr!

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 72 980 11302

UP = 250,000 lbs. DOWN = 220,000 lbs. ROTATING = 230,000 Ibs. TRIP GAS: 0

CONN: 1830

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKGGAS: 1000-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWNTIME:



DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/19/2004 Days: 42

Depth: 11494' KB Prog: 137 OPR: DRILLINGAl·EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 676 TMC: $ 75,444 TDC: $ $ 16,351 CWC: $ $ 1,310,132

Contractor NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 10.3 Liner: 6 Bit #: 10 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 44 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT8768 surf.csg: S - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/12 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 7/14/21 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod cag: $ - BHA: $ 1,700

ph: 9.0 GPM: 400 Type: F57YOD Fioat Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12 NV: Jets: 3-20 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 11310 TBG/Rods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ -

Sand: 0.7 Dev: out: 11610 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10.0 FTG: 300' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 11,500 Hrs: 56 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/4.9 FPH: 5.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

Ca: 80 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: S 676

DAP 5.3 WOB: 41 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim : Break Dow n: RPM: 45/52 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55 6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,351

06:00 23:00 17.0 DRLG 11494'-11610' TD, (116 FT, 6.8 FPH) cum.wtr: S 21,389

23:00 1:00 2.0 CIRC AND COND MUD Cum. Fuel $ 65,704

1:00 2:00 1.0 SHORT TRIP 5 STDS. cum.Bits: S 123,600

2:00 5:00 3 CIRC AND COND MUD Cum. Rot. Hrs

5:00 6:00 1.0 WO SCHLUMBERGER

REACHED 11,610' TD AT 23:00 HR., 9/19/04.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 68 780 11586

UP = 260,000 lbs. DOWN = 220,000 lbs. ROTATING - 236,000 lbs. TRIP GAS:

CONN: 2080

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 900-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/19/2004 Days: 42

Depth: 11494' KB Prog: 137 OPR: DRILLINGAl·EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 676 TMC: $ 75,444 TDC: $ $ 16,351 CWC: $ $ 1,310,132

Contractor NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 10.3 Liner: 6 Bit #: 10 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 44 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT8768 surf.csg: S - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/12 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 7/14/21 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod cag: $ - BHA: $ 1,700

ph: 9.0 GPM: 400 Type: F57YOD Fioat Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12 NV: Jets: 3-20 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 11310 TBG/Rods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ -

Sand: 0.7 Dev: out: 11610 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10.0 FTG: 300' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 11,500 Hrs: 56 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/4.9 FPH: 5.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

Ca: 80 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: S 676

DAP 5.3 WOB: 41 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim : Break Dow n: RPM: 45/52 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55 6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,351

06:00 23:00 17.0 DRLG 11494'-11610' TD, (116 FT, 6.8 FPH) cum.wtr: S 21,389

23:00 1:00 2.0 CIRC AND COND MUD Cum. Fuel $ 65,704

1:00 2:00 1.0 SHORT TRIP 5 STDS. cum.Bits: S 123,600

2:00 5:00 3 CIRC AND COND MUD Cum. Rot. Hrs

5:00 6:00 1.0 WO SCHLUMBERGER

REACHED 11,610' TD AT 23:00 HR., 9/19/04.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 68 780 11586

UP = 260,000 lbs. DOWN = 220,000 lbs. ROTATING - 236,000 lbs. TRIP GAS:

CONN: 2080

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 900-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/19/2004 Days: 42

Depth: 11494' KB Prog: 137 OPR: DRILLINGAl·EAD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 676 TMC: $ 75,444 TDC: $ $ 16,351 CWC: $ $ 1,310,132

Contractor NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw: 10.3 Liner: 6 Bit #: 10 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

vis: 44 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT8768 surf.csg: S - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/12 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 7/14/21 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod cag: $ - BHA: $ 1,700

ph: 9.0 GPM: 400 Type: F57YOD Fioat Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12 NV: Jets: 3-20 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 775

Cake: 2 AV: In: 11310 TBG/Rods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ -

Sand: 0.7 Dev: out: 11610 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10.0 FTG: 300' Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chls: 11,500 Hrs: 56 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/4.9 FPH: 5.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 850

Ca: 80 TIBIG: Pumping LTT: $ - Drilling Mud: S 676

DAP 5.3 WOB: 41 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Tim : Break Dow n: RPM: 45/52 Misc: $ - Forklift: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55 6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 16,351

06:00 23:00 17.0 DRLG 11494'-11610' TD, (116 FT, 6.8 FPH) cum.wtr: S 21,389

23:00 1:00 2.0 CIRC AND COND MUD Cum. Fuel $ 65,704

1:00 2:00 1.0 SHORT TRIP 5 STDS. cum.Bits: S 123,600

2:00 5:00 3 CIRC AND COND MUD Cum. Rot. Hrs

5:00 6:00 1.0 WO SCHLUMBERGER

REACHED 11,610' TD AT 23:00 HR., 9/19/04.

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 68 780 11586

UP = 260,000 lbs. DOWN = 220,000 lbs. ROTATING - 236,000 lbs. TRIP GAS:

CONN: 2080

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 900-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN



DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/20/2004 Days: 43

Depth: 11610 T KB Prog: 0 OPR: CIRC AND CON ) MUD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 709 TMC: $ 76,153 TDC: $ $ 47,315 CWC: $ $ 1,357,447

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw; 10.3 Liner: 6 Bit #: 10 RR conductor: Rig Move: $ -

viS: 43 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT8768 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/12 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 7/14/21 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.0 GPM: 400 Type: F57YOD Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12 NV: Jets: - Well Head: $ - Mud Logger; $ -

Cake: 2 AV: In: TBG/Rods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ 4,853

Sand: 0.7 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10.0 FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 11,500 Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/4.9 FPH: Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 80 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 709

DAP 5.3 wos: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 28,553

Tim : Break Dom n: RPM: Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 47,315

06:00 8:00 2.0 CIRC AND WO SCHLUMBERGER cum. wtr: $ 21,389

8:00 14:00 6.0 POOH FOR OPEN HOLE LOGS Cum. Fuel $ 70,557

14:00 22:00 6.0 MIRUSCHLUMBERGER. RAN PE IND., NEU-DENW/ GR FROM cum.Bits: $ 123,600

T16,625' LTDTO BASE SURF CSG. Cum. Rot. HrE

22:00 6:00 8.0 TIH CIRC OUT GAS AT 5500' AND 9100'

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 68 780 11586

UP = 260,000 lbs. DOWN = 220,000 lbs. ROTATING = 236,000 lbs. TRIP GAS:

CONN: 2080

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 900-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/20/2004 Days: 43

Depth: 11610 T KB Prog: 0 OPR: CIRC AND CON ) MUD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 709 TMC: $ 76,153 TDC: $ $ 47,315 CWC: $ $ 1,357,447

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw; 10.3 Liner: 6 Bit #: 10 RR conductor: Rig Move: $ -

viS: 43 Stroke: 10 SIN: MT8768 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVIYP: 9/12 SPM: 115 Size: 7-7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 10,800

Gel: 7/14/21 Press: 1750 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: 9.0 GPM: 400 Type: F57YOD Float Equp; $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12 NV: Jets: - Well Head: $ - Mud Logger; $ -

Cake: 2 AV: In: TBG/Rods: $ - WaterlFuel: $ 4,853

Sand: 0.7 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10.0 FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,420

Chis: 11,500 Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: .4/4.9 FPH: Heater: $ - consultant: $ 850

ca: 80 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 709

DAP 5.3 wos: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 28,553

Tim : Break Dom n: RPM: Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 47,315

06:00 8:00 2.0 CIRC AND WO SCHLUMBERGER cum. wtr: $ 21,389

8:00 14:00 6.0 POOH FOR OPEN HOLE LOGS Cum. Fuel $ 70,557

14:00 22:00 6.0 MIRUSCHLUMBERGER. RAN PE IND., NEU-DENW/ GR FROM cum.Bits: $ 123,600

T16,625' LTDTO BASE SURF CSG. Cum. Rot. HrE

22:00 6:00 8.0 TIH CIRC OUT GAS AT 5500' AND 9100'

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
N°2 68 780 11586

UP = 260,000 lbs. DOWN = 220,000 lbs. ROTATING = 236,000 lbs. TRIP GAS:

CONN: 2080

BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 900-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN

DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED 43-30-9-19 Date: 9/20/2004 Days: 43

Depth: 11610 T KB Prog: 0 OPR: CIRC AND CON ) MUD Formation: MESAVERDE

DMC: $ 709 TMC: $ 76,153 TDC: $ $ 47,315 CWC: $ $ 1,357,447

Contractor: NABORS 611 Mud Co: MIDRL( FLUIDS TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

Mw; 10.3 Liner: 6 Bit #: 10 RR conductor: Rig Move: $ -
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Tim : Break Dom n: RPM: Misc: $ - Forkilft: $ 130

START END TIME BHA: 55.6K Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 47,315

06:00 8:00 2.0 CIRC AND WO SCHLUMBERGER cum. wtr: $ 21,389

8:00 14:00 6.0 POOH FOR OPEN HOLE LOGS Cum. Fuel $ 70,557

14:00 22:00 6.0 MIRUSCHLUMBERGER. RAN PE IND., NEU-DENW/ GR FROM cum.Bits: $ 123,600

T16,625' LTDTO BASE SURF CSG. Cum. Rot. HrE

22:00 6:00 8.0 TIH CIRC OUT GAS AT 5500' AND 9100'

PUMP SPM PRESS DEPTH
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BHA: 7-7/8" BIT, MUDMOTOR, 23 6-3/8" DC. BKG GAS: 900-1200

CONSULTANT: V GUINN BHA Total length = 748.10 DWN



DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT
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21:00 22:00 1.0 RU CASING CREW AND HOLD SAFETY MEETING.

22:00 22:30 0.5 PULLWEAR BUSHING

22:30 6:00 7.5 RUNNING4½" CSG, INCOMPLETE.

TRIP GAS:

CONN:

BKG GAS:

CONSULTANT: V GUINN DWN
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Federal 43-30-9-19
NE/SE

Sec 30,T9S-R19E J,.. f ff SS¯3/f'3

Uintah County, UT

Federal 43-30-9-19 (Lightning Rod)

Build loc

5/?/04 Huffman Enterprises on loc to build rd and loc. DC $ CWC $

5/15/04 Water Service and Supply on loc to line pit. DC $9780 CWC

Set 13 3/8" conductor

6/6/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout Svc rig to spud well. Drill dn and set 16"
conductor. Drill to 240'. RIH w/ 13 3/8", 54.50#, J-55 esg and set @
240' GL. RU Big 4 and cmt csg back to surface w/ 260 sx Class "G" neat
cmt @15.6 ppg.

6/7/04 Drill out and drill dn to 800' GL. RDMOL. DC $35,100 CWC _.

6/8/04 Start filling reserve pit w/ wtr.

Completion

10/23/04 Frac tks filled w/ 2% Kcl. CC-$1,370,252

10/25/04 Tk battery 50 % complete. DC 6258 CC$ 1,376,510

10/26/04 RU Weatherford Wellserv Wireline. Ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray log.
RU Doublejack testing and tested esg to 8500 psi and held for 15 min, ok.
Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11375 - 77, 11410 - 16, 11432 - 36', 3 spf w/ 3
1/8" slick gun, 19 gm chgs, .47 EHD, 19" pen. All shots fired. RDMOL
and move to State 7-36A. (SCE) DC $1740CC$ 1,378,250

10/27/04 MI Weatherford Wellserv Wireline for tomorrows frac. Complete tank
battery. DC-$101,000(facilities) CC$1,479,250

10/28/04 RU SLB Pumping Services (Bakersfield). Break down Stage 1 Mesaverde
with 5483psi. Perform reverse step rate test with Slickwater and Clay frac.
ISIP 4725psi, 25 holes open. Frac Stage 1 with 74,853# of 20-40 SBXL
using 2388 bbls of Slickwater and YF118st gell. ATP 6977psi at 50 BPM.
ISIP 4750 psi. Turned well on a 10,12,14/64 ok and cleaned up for 6hrs
and made 491 BF. FFP 3500psi. RU Wellserv and set a 10K FTFP at
11310'. Perforated Mesaverde Stage 2 f/ 11,182 - 84', 11,194 -96',
11,229 - 31', 11,268 - 71', 11,291 - 93', 3 spf as above. Break down
Stage 2 with 5759psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 20 holes open. ISIP
4500psi. Hybrid Frac with 87475# of 20-40 SBXL sand, using 2508 bbls
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Federal 43-30-9-19
NE/SE

Sec 30,T9S-R19E
Uintah County, UT

of Slickwater and YF 118 ST. ATP 7096psi at 48.2 BPM. ISIP 4540 psi.
Flowed well overnight on a 10,12,14/64 ck for 8 hrs and made 812BF.
TR-1303. BLWTR-3594 DC 44,124 CC-$1,523,374

10/29/04 RU Wellserv, set a 10K FTFP at 11050'. Gun failed, POOH and GIH with
new gun and perforated Stage 3 10903'-907', 10931'-933', 10960'-962',
l1030'-034' 3SPF. RU SLB (Bakersfield) Break down Stage 3 with
5730psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 27 holes open. ISIP 4250psi.
Hybrid frac with 114,208# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2894 Bbls of
Slickwater and YF 118ST fluid. ATP 7239psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4600psi.
Flow well back for 4 hrs. RU Wellserve and set a 10K FTFP at 10742'.
Perforate Stage 4 Mesaverde 10580'-584', 10630'-632', 10643'-645',
10690'-692", 10722'-726' 3 SPF. (JDL) DC$34068 CC-$1,557,442

10/30/04 Flowed well a total of 22 hrs and made 1807 BF. TR-3110. BLWTR-
4681. FFP 3100psi on a 14/64 ck. RU SLB PS(Bakersfield). Broke Stage
4 with 5890psi. Perform reverse step rate test. ISIP 4050psi. 25 holes
open.Hybrid Frac Stage 4 Mesaverde with 131,310# of 20-40 SBXL
sand using 3351 Bbls of Slickwater and YF 118ST gell. ATP 6567 at 50
BPM. ISIP-3950psi. Turned well at 10:40AM with a 10/64 ck. Flowed
well 20 hrs on a 12&l4/64 ck and made 2043BF, TR-5153BF, BLWTR-
5989. FFP-3000psi on a 14/64ck. Frac cost-$473,204. CC- $2,030,646
(JDL)

10/31/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 2043 bb1s.
TR 5153. BLWTR 5989. (SCE)

11/1/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ek. Made 1443 bbls.
TR 6596. BLWTR 4546. (SCE)DC-$11,850 CC-$2,042,496

11/2/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @2400 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 890 bbls.
TR 7496. BLWTR 3646. (SCE)

11/4/04 Fin RIH w/ tbg. RU power swivel and drill up kill plug 10490'. Drilled
up FTFP's @11050', 11310', 11457'. Cleaned well out to PBTD @
11457'. LD 29 jts and landed tbg @10534' w/ 327 jts. ND BOPE. NU
tree. Pumped bit sub off. Put well back on flowback for night. SDFN.
(KF w/ Premier). DC 7430

11/5/04 Well flowed up csg for 14 hrs. Made 745 bb1sw/ 1250 on 15/64" ck. TR
9191. BLWTR 2056.

C:\DOCUME~1\OGMUSER\LOCALS~1\Temp\FEDERA~1.DOC
Page 2 of

Federal 43-30-9-19
NE/SE

Sec 30,T9S-R19E
Uintah County, UT

of Slickwater and YF 118 ST. ATP 7096psi at 48.2 BPM. ISIP 4540 psi.
Flowed well overnight on a 10,12,14/64 ck for 8 hrs and made 812BF.
TR-1303. BLWTR-3594 DC 44,124 CC-$1,523,374

10/29/04 RU Wellserv, set a 10K FTFP at 11050'. Gun failed, POOH and GIH with
new gun and perforated Stage 3 10903'-907', 10931'-933', 10960'-962',
l1030'-034' 3SPF. RU SLB (Bakersfield) Break down Stage 3 with
5730psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 27 holes open. ISIP 4250psi.
Hybrid frac with 114,208# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2894 Bbls of
Slickwater and YF 118ST fluid. ATP 7239psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4600psi.
Flow well back for 4 hrs. RU Wellserve and set a 10K FTFP at 10742'.
Perforate Stage 4 Mesaverde 10580'-584', 10630'-632', 10643'-645',
10690'-692", 10722'-726' 3 SPF. (JDL) DC$34068 CC-$1,557,442

10/30/04 Flowed well a total of 22 hrs and made 1807 BF. TR-3110. BLWTR-
4681. FFP 3100psi on a 14/64 ck. RU SLB PS(Bakersfield). Broke Stage
4 with 5890psi. Perform reverse step rate test. ISIP 4050psi. 25 holes
open.Hybrid Frac Stage 4 Mesaverde with 131,310# of 20-40 SBXL
sand using 3351 Bbls of Slickwater and YF 118ST gell. ATP 6567 at 50
BPM. ISIP-3950psi. Turned well at 10:40AM with a 10/64 ck. Flowed
well 20 hrs on a 12&l4/64 ck and made 2043BF, TR-5153BF, BLWTR-
5989. FFP-3000psi on a 14/64ck. Frac cost-$473,204. CC- $2,030,646
(JDL)

10/31/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 2043 bb1s.
TR 5153. BLWTR 5989. (SCE)

11/1/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ek. Made 1443 bbls.
TR 6596. BLWTR 4546. (SCE)DC-$11,850 CC-$2,042,496

11/2/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @2400 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 890 bbls.
TR 7496. BLWTR 3646. (SCE)

11/4/04 Fin RIH w/ tbg. RU power swivel and drill up kill plug 10490'. Drilled
up FTFP's @11050', 11310', 11457'. Cleaned well out to PBTD @
11457'. LD 29 jts and landed tbg @10534' w/ 327 jts. ND BOPE. NU
tree. Pumped bit sub off. Put well back on flowback for night. SDFN.
(KF w/ Premier). DC 7430

11/5/04 Well flowed up csg for 14 hrs. Made 745 bb1sw/ 1250 on 15/64" ck. TR
9191. BLWTR 2056.

C:\DOCUME~1\OGMUSER\LOCALS~1\Temp\FEDERA~1.DOC
Page 2 of

Federal 43-30-9-19
NE/SE

Sec 30,T9S-R19E
Uintah County, UT

of Slickwater and YF 118 ST. ATP 7096psi at 48.2 BPM. ISIP 4540 psi.
Flowed well overnight on a 10,12,14/64 ck for 8 hrs and made 812BF.
TR-1303. BLWTR-3594 DC 44,124 CC-$1,523,374

10/29/04 RU Wellserv, set a 10K FTFP at 11050'. Gun failed, POOH and GIH with
new gun and perforated Stage 3 10903'-907', 10931'-933', 10960'-962',
l1030'-034' 3SPF. RU SLB (Bakersfield) Break down Stage 3 with
5730psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 27 holes open. ISIP 4250psi.
Hybrid frac with 114,208# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2894 Bbls of
Slickwater and YF 118ST fluid. ATP 7239psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4600psi.
Flow well back for 4 hrs. RU Wellserve and set a 10K FTFP at 10742'.
Perforate Stage 4 Mesaverde 10580'-584', 10630'-632', 10643'-645',
10690'-692", 10722'-726' 3 SPF. (JDL) DC$34068 CC-$1,557,442

10/30/04 Flowed well a total of 22 hrs and made 1807 BF. TR-3110. BLWTR-
4681. FFP 3100psi on a 14/64 ck. RU SLB PS(Bakersfield). Broke Stage
4 with 5890psi. Perform reverse step rate test. ISIP 4050psi. 25 holes
open.Hybrid Frac Stage 4 Mesaverde with 131,310# of 20-40 SBXL
sand using 3351 Bbls of Slickwater and YF 118ST gell. ATP 6567 at 50
BPM. ISIP-3950psi. Turned well at 10:40AM with a 10/64 ck. Flowed
well 20 hrs on a 12&l4/64 ck and made 2043BF, TR-5153BF, BLWTR-
5989. FFP-3000psi on a 14/64ck. Frac cost-$473,204. CC- $2,030,646
(JDL)

10/31/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 2043 bb1s.
TR 5153. BLWTR 5989. (SCE)

11/1/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ek. Made 1443 bbls.
TR 6596. BLWTR 4546. (SCE)DC-$11,850 CC-$2,042,496

11/2/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @2400 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 890 bbls.
TR 7496. BLWTR 3646. (SCE)

11/4/04 Fin RIH w/ tbg. RU power swivel and drill up kill plug 10490'. Drilled
up FTFP's @11050', 11310', 11457'. Cleaned well out to PBTD @
11457'. LD 29 jts and landed tbg @10534' w/ 327 jts. ND BOPE. NU
tree. Pumped bit sub off. Put well back on flowback for night. SDFN.
(KF w/ Premier). DC 7430

11/5/04 Well flowed up csg for 14 hrs. Made 745 bb1sw/ 1250 on 15/64" ck. TR
9191. BLWTR 2056.
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Sec 30,T9S-R19E
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11/6/04 Well flowed up csg for 10 hrs. Made 405 bbls w/ 1250 on 16/64" ck. TR
9596. BLWTR 1651. Shut well in to put dn line. Natco fired up sep. Fd
plates on back of tks off. Will replace and put well dn line tomorrow AM.
Left well SI for night. (SCE)

11/7/04 Turned well over to pumper (Scott McKinnon) for turn on to Sales. (SCE)
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0 5 4 Federal 43-30-9-19

NE/SE
Sec 30,T9S-R19E

Uintah County, UT

Federal 43-30-9-19 (Lightning Rod)

Build loc

5/?/04 Huffman Enterprises on loc to build rd and loc. DC $ CWC $

5/15/04 Water Service and Supply on loc to line pit. DC $9780 CWC

Set 13 3/8" conductor

6/6/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout Svc rig to spud well. Drill dn and set 16"
conductor. Drill to 240'. RIH w/ 13 3/8", 54.50#, J-55 esg and set @
240' GL. RU Big 4 and cmt csg back to surface w/ 260 sx Class "G" neat
cmt @15.6 ppg.

6/7/04 Drill out and drill dn to 800' GL. RDMOL. DC $35,100 CWC .

6/8/04 Start filling reserve pit w/ wtr.

Completion

10/23/04 Frac tks filled w/ 2% Kel.

10/25/04 Tk battery 50 % complete. DC 6258

10/26/04 RU Weatherford Wellserv Wireline. Ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray log.
RU Doublejack testing and tested csg to 8500 psi and held for 15 min, ok.
Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11375 - 77, 11410 - 16, 11432 - 36', 3 spf w/ 3
1/8" slick gun, 19 gm chgs, .47 EHD, 19" pen. All shots fired. RDMOL
and move to State 7-36A. (SCE) DC 1740

10/27/04 MI Weatherford Wellserv Wireline for tomorrows frac.

10/28/04 RU SLB Pumping Services (Bakersfield). Break down Stage 1 Mesaverde
with 5483psi. Perform reverse step rate test with Slickwater and Clay frac.
ISIP 4725psi, 25 holes open. Frac Stage 1 with 74,853# of 20-40 SBXL
using 2388 bbls of Slickwater and YFll8st gell. ATP 6977psi at 50 BPM.
ISIP 4750 psi. Turned well on a 10,12,14/64 ck and cleaned up for 6hrs
and made 491 BF. FFP 3500psi. RU Wellserv and set a 10K FTFP at
11310'. Perforated Mesaverde Stage 2 f/ 11,182 - 84', l1,194 -96',
11,229 - 31', l 1,268 - 71', l 1,291 - 93', 3 spf as above. Break down
Stage 2 with 5759psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 20 holes open. ISIP
4500psi. Hybrid Frac with 87475# of 20-40 SBXL sand, using 2508 bbls
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of Slickwater and YF 118 ST. ATP 7096psi at 48.2 BPM. ISIP 4540 psi.
Flowed well overnight on a 10,12,14/64 ck for 8 hrs and made 812BF.
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Mesaverde Stage 2 fl 11,182 - 84', 11,194 - 96', 11,229 - 31', 11,268

- 71', 11,291 - 93', 3 spf as above. Break down Stage 2 with 5759psi.
Perform reverse step rate test, 20 holes open. ISIP 4500psi. Hybrid Frac
with 87475# of 20-40 SBXL sand, using 2508 bbls of Slickwater and YF
118 ST. ATP 7096psi at 48.2 BPM. ISIP 4540 psi. Flowed well overnight
on a 10,12,14/64 ck for 8 hrs and made 812BF. TR-1303. BLWTR-3594
DC 44,124 (JDL)

10/29/04 RU Wellserv, set a 10K FTFP at 11050'. Gun failed, POOH and GIH with
new gun and perforated Stage 3 10903'-907', 10931'-933', 10960'-962',
l1030'-034' 3SPF. RU SLB (Bakersfield) Break down Stage 3 with
5730psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 27 holes open. ISIP 4250psi.
Hybrid frac with 114,208# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2894 Bbls of
Slickwater and YF 118ST fluid. ATP 7239psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4600psi.
Flow well back for 4 hrs. RU Wellserve and set a 10K FTFP at 10742'.
Perforate Stage 4 Mesaverde 10580'-584', 10630'-632', 10643'-645',
10690'-692", 10722'-726' 3 SPF. (JDL)

10/30/04 Flowed well a total of 22 hrs and made 1807 BF. TR-3110. BLWTR-
4681. FFP 3100psi on a 14/64 ck. RU SLB PS(Bakersfield). Broke Stage
4 with 5890psi. Perform reverse step rate test. ISIP 4050psi. 25 holes
open.Hybrid Frac Stage 4 Mesaverde with 131,310# of 20-40 SBXL sand
using 3351 Bbls of Slickwater and YF 118ST gell. ATP 6567 at 50 BPM.
ISIP-3950psi. Turned well at 10:40AM with a 10/64 ck. Flowed well 20
hrs on a 12&l4/64 ek and made 2043BF, TR-5153BF, BLWTR-5989.
FFP-3000psi on a 14/64ck. Frac cost-$473,204. CC- (JDL)

10/31/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 2043 bbls.
TR 5153. BLWTR 5989. (SCE)

11/1/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 1443 bbls.
TR 6596. BLWTR 4546. (SCE)
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l1/2/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @2400 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 890 bbls.
TR 7496. BLWTR 3646. (SCE)
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Form 3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

,999, DEP ENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNO. 1004-0137

BU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. LeaseSerialNo.

UTU-37246
II-i-IIII IIII

l a. Type of Wen 0 011 B oss O Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: New Work Over Deepen O Plug Back Diff Resvr. NA

Othêr
7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and

NA
2. Name of Operator L , MaseName and Well No
Gasco Production Company FMI HJ&O 19
3. Address 3a. Phone No (include area code)
14 Inverness Drive East, Ste. H-236, Englewood, CO 80112 | 303-483-0044

43ellN

4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)*
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

At surface 1980' FSL & 659' FEL (NESE) Sec. 30-T9S-Ri9E, SLM Riverbend
11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and

At top prod. interval reported below SAME Survey or Are30-T9S-R19E
12. County or Parish 13. State

At total depth SAME uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D Reached 16 te Completed 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

D & A I X | | Ready to Prod06/06/04 09/19/04 10/23/04 4828' KBI 4810' GL

18. Total Depth: MD 11,610 19. Plug Back T D: MD 20. Depth I ridge Plug Set MD

TVD 11,610 TVD TVD

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical oys Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Was well cored? No es(Submit analysis)

Was DST run? No es (Submit copy)
CICNLIGRISP: Directional Survey? No es (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#lft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry Vol Cement Top* Amount Pulled
Depth Type of Cement (BBL)

17-1/2" 13-3/8" J-55 54.4# surface 240 260 Class "G" surface
12-1/4" 8-5/8" M-50 28# surface 3622 635 HILift+ 200 10-2RFC Surface

7-7/8" 4-1/2" P110 13.5# surface 11528 500 HILift+1650 50/50 Poz/G surface

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size lepth Set (MI acker Set (MD

2 3/8" 10534

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status

A) Mesaverde 11375 11436 11375-77, 11410-16, 11432-36 3-3/8" gun, .47" EHD 36 producing
B) Mesaverde 11182 11293 11182-84, 11194-96, 11229•31, 11268-71, 11291-93 3-318" gun, .47" EHD 33 producing
C) Mesaverde 10903 11034 10903-07, 10931-33, 10960-62, 11030-34 3-3/8" gun, .47" EHD 36 producing

D) Mesaverde 10580 10726 10580-84, 10630-32, 10643-45 3-318" gun, .47" EHD 24 producing

y) (Continued) (Cont'd) 10690-92, 10722-26 3-3/8" gun, .47" EHD 18 producing

F1
H)
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement S. ueeze, Etc.

Depth Intelval Amount and type of Material
11375-11436 74853# of 2040 SBXL sand, using 2388 bbis Slickwater and YF118st pel.
11182-11293 87475# of 2040 SBXL sand, using 2508 bbis Slickwater and YF118st gel.
10903-11034 114208# of 20-40 SBXL sand, using 2894 bbis Slickwater and YF118st get
10580-10726 131310# of 2040 SBXL sand, using 3351 bbis SIIckwater and YF118st gel.

28. Production - Interval A-D Mesaverde
Date First Test Date Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity duction Method

Produced Tested Producti BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

11/07/04 """""" " Flowirig
Choke Tbg. Press Csg.

Size Flwg. X Press

10/64" si 1950 2550 5 1069 0 ty MODr

Date First Test Date Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravky EXP RÉÚonMethod
Produced Tested Pro cti BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

RFCEIVED

(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&

Form 3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

,999, DEP ENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNO. 1004-0137

BU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. LeaseSerialNo.

UTU-37246
II-i-IIII IIII

l a. Type of Wen 0 011 B oss O Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: New Work Over Deepen O Plug Back Diff Resvr. NA

Othêr
7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and

NA
2. Name of Operator L , MaseName and Well No
Gasco Production Company FMI HJ&O 19
3. Address 3a. Phone No (include area code)
14 Inverness Drive East, Ste. H-236, Englewood, CO 80112 | 303-483-0044

43ellN

4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)*
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

At surface 1980' FSL & 659' FEL (NESE) Sec. 30-T9S-Ri9E, SLM Riverbend
11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and

At top prod. interval reported below SAME Survey or Are30-T9S-R19E
12. County or Parish 13. State

At total depth SAME uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D Reached 16 te Completed 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

D & A I X | | Ready to Prod
06/06/04 09/19/04 10/23/04 4828' KBI 4810' GL

18. Total Depth: MD 11,610 19. Plug Back T D: MD 20. Depth I ridge Plug Set MD

TVD 11,610 TVD TVD

21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical oys Run (Submit copy of each) 22. Was well cored? No es(Submit analysis)

Was DST run? No es (Submit copy)
CICNLIGRISP: Directional Survey? No es (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#lft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry Vol Cement Top* Amount Pulled
Depth Type of Cement (BBL)
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Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size lepth Set (MI acker Set (MD
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2Ìfu.
Date First Test Hours Test Oi Gas Water Oil Gravity Ga ty Production Method

Produced Date Tested Production B . MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press, Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status

Size Elwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

28b. Production

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method

Produced Date Tested Pr n BBL MCF 881. Corr. API

Choke Tbg, Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status

Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

29. Disposition of Gas (Sold, used forfuel,vented, etc.)

Sold
30. Sununary of Porous Zones (include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thercof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem

tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures

and recoverics.

Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name

Meas. Depth

Uinta Surface 5,237

Wasatch 5,238 9,042 Sand and Shale

Mesaverde 9,043 11,506 Sand and Shale

Castlegate 11,507 Sand

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (l full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey

5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5, Core Analysis 7. Other

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instmetions)*

Name (please print) J onqwell 4 4 Title Operations Manager

Signature Date January 28, 2005

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Titl 43 .S.C. Sectio 1212,make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraud en statements of representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

RECEIVED . o U.S. GPO: 1999-573-62

JUL1 1 2005

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&
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O O
Federal 43-30-9-19

NE/SE
Sec 30,T9S-R19E ppy ‡ C/3 UŸý- 35¯3 V3

Uintah County, UT

Federal 43-30-9-19 (Lightning Rod)

Build loc

5/?/04 Huffman Enterprises on loc to build rd and loc. DC $ CWC $

5/15/04 Water Service and Supply on loc to line pit. DC $9780 CWC

Set 13 3/8" conductor

6/6/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout Svc rig to spud well. Drill dn and set 16"
conductor. Drill to 240'. RIH w/ 13 3/8", 54.50#, J-55 csg and set @
240' GL. RU Big 4 and cmt csg back to surface w/ 260 sx Class "G"
neat cmt @15.6 ppg.

6/7/04 Drill out and drill dn to 800' GL. RDMOL. DC $35,100 CWC _.

6/8/04 Start filling reserve pit w/ wtr.

Completion

10/23/04 Frac tks filled w/ 2% Kel. CC-$1,370,252

10/25/04 Tk battery 50 % complete. DC 6258 CC$ 1,376,510

10/26/04 RU Weatherford Wellserv Wireline. Ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray log.
RU Doublejack testing and tested csg to 8500 psi and held for 15 min,
ok. Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11375 - 77, 11410 - 16, 11432 - 36', 3 spf w/
3 1/8" slick gun, 19 gm chgs, .47 EHD, 19" pen. All shots fired.
RDMOL and move to State 7-36A. (SCE) DC $1740CC$ 1,378,250

10/27/04 MI Weatherford Wellserv Wireline for tomorrows frac. Complete
tank battery. DC-$101,000(facilities) CC$1,479,250

10/28/04 RU SLB Pumping Services (Bakersfield). Break down Stage 1
Mesaverde with 5483psi. Perform reverse step rate test with
Slickwater and Clay frac. ISIP 4725psi, 25 holes open. Frac Stage 1
with 74,853# of 20-40 SBXL using 2388 bbls of Slickwater and
YFll8st gell. ATP 6977psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4750 psi. Turned well on
a 10,12,14/64 ck and cleaned up for 6hrs and made 491 BF. FFP
3500psi. RU Wellserv and set a 10K FTFP at 11310'. Perforated
Mesaverde Stage 2 f/ l l,182 - 84', 11,194 - 96', 11,229 - 31', 11,268

- 71', l1,291 - 93', 3 spf as above. Break down Stage 2 with 5759psi.
Perform reverse step rate test, 20 holes open. ISIP 4500psi. Hybrid

C:\DOCUMEETW9GÑlUgWM&gL &pgr digiPS32@29b¾s(Lightning
Rod).doc
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Federal 43-30-9-19
NE/SE

Sec 30,T9S-R19E
Uintah County, UT

of Slickwater and YF 118 ST. ATP 7096psi at 48.2 BPM. ISIP 4540
psi. Flowed well overnight on a 10,12,14/64 ck for 8 hrs and made
812BF. TR-1303. BLWTR-3594 DC 44,124 CC-$1,523,374

10/29/04 RU Wellserv, set a 10K FTFP at 11050'. Gun failed, POOH and GIH
with new gun and perforated Stage 3 10903'-907', 10931'-933',
10960'-962', l1030'-034' 3SPF. RU SLB (Bakersfield) Break down
Stage 3 with 5730psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 27 holes open.
ISIP 4250psi. Hybrid frac with 114,208# of 20-40 SBXL sand using
2894 Bbls of Slickwater and YF 118ST fluid. ATP 7239psi at 50 BPM.
ISIP 4600psi. Flow well back for 4 hrs. RU Wellserve and set a 10K
FTFP at 10742'. Perforate Stage 4 Mesaverde 10580'-584', 10630'-
632', 10643'-645', 10690'-692", 10722'-726' 3 SPF. (JDL) DC$34068
CC-$1,557,442

10/30/04 Flowed well a total of 22 hrs and made 1807 BF. TR-3110. BLWTR-
4681. FFP 3100psi on a 14/64 ck. RU SLB PS(Bakersfield). Broke
Stage 4 with 5890psi. Perform reverse step rate test. ISIP 4050psi. 25
holes open.Hybrid Frac Stage 4 Mesaverde with 131,310# of 20-40
SBXL sand using 3351 Bbls of Slickwater and YF 118ST gell. ATP
6567 at 50 BPM. ISIP-3950psi. Turned well at 10:40AM with a 10/64
ek. Flowed well 20 hrs on a 12&l4/64 ck and made 2043BF, TR-
5153BF, BLWTR-5989. FFP-3000psi on a 14/64ck. Frac cost-
$473,204.CC- $2,030,646(JDL)

10/31/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 2043
bbls. TR 5153. BLWTR 5989. (SCE)

11/1/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 1443
bbls. TR 6596. BLWTR 4546. (SCE)DC-$11,850 CC-$2,042,496

11/2/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @2400 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 890
bbls. TR 7496. BLWTR 3646. (SCE)

11/4/04 Fin RIH w/ tbg. RU power swivel and drill up kill plug 10490'.
Drilled up FTFP's @l1050', l1310', l1457'. Cleaned well out to
PBTD @l1457'. LD 29 jts and landed tbg @10534' w/ 327 jts. ND
BOPE. NU tree. Pumped bit sub off. Put well back on flowback for
night. SDFN. (KF w/ Premier). DC 7430

11/5/04 Well flowed up csg for 14 hrs. Made 745 bbls w/ 1250 on 15/64" ck.
TR 9191. BLWTR 2056.
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812BF. TR-1303. BLWTR-3594 DC 44,124 CC-$1,523,374

10/29/04 RU Wellserv, set a 10K FTFP at 11050'. Gun failed, POOH and GIH
with new gun and perforated Stage 3 10903'-907', 10931'-933',
10960'-962', l1030'-034' 3SPF. RU SLB (Bakersfield) Break down
Stage 3 with 5730psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 27 holes open.
ISIP 4250psi. Hybrid frac with 114,208# of 20-40 SBXL sand using
2894 Bbls of Slickwater and YF 118ST fluid. ATP 7239psi at 50 BPM.
ISIP 4600psi. Flow well back for 4 hrs. RU Wellserve and set a 10K
FTFP at 10742'. Perforate Stage 4 Mesaverde 10580'-584', 10630'-
632', 10643'-645', 10690'-692", 10722'-726' 3 SPF. (JDL) DC$34068
CC-$1,557,442

10/30/04 Flowed well a total of 22 hrs and made 1807 BF. TR-3110. BLWTR-
4681. FFP 3100psi on a 14/64 ck. RU SLB PS(Bakersfield). Broke
Stage 4 with 5890psi. Perform reverse step rate test. ISIP 4050psi. 25
holes open.Hybrid Frac Stage 4 Mesaverde with 131,310# of 20-40
SBXL sand using 3351 Bbls of Slickwater and YF 118ST gell. ATP
6567 at 50 BPM. ISIP-3950psi. Turned well at 10:40AM with a 10/64
ek. Flowed well 20 hrs on a 12&l4/64 ck and made 2043BF, TR-
5153BF, BLWTR-5989. FFP-3000psi on a 14/64ck. Frac cost-
$473,204.CC- $2,030,646(JDL)

10/31/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 2043
bbls. TR 5153. BLWTR 5989. (SCE)

11/1/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 1443
bbls. TR 6596. BLWTR 4546. (SCE)DC-$11,850 CC-$2,042,496

11/2/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @2400 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 890
bbls. TR 7496. BLWTR 3646. (SCE)

11/4/04 Fin RIH w/ tbg. RU power swivel and drill up kill plug 10490'.
Drilled up FTFP's @l1050', l1310', l1457'. Cleaned well out to
PBTD @l1457'. LD 29 jts and landed tbg @10534' w/ 327 jts. ND
BOPE. NU tree. Pumped bit sub off. Put well back on flowback for
night. SDFN. (KF w/ Premier). DC 7430

11/5/04 Well flowed up csg for 14 hrs. Made 745 bbls w/ 1250 on 15/64" ck.
TR 9191. BLWTR 2056.

C:\DOCUME~1\OGMUSER\LOCALS~1\Temp\Federal 43-30-9-19 (Lightning
Rod).doc

Page 2 of

Federal 43-30-9-19
NE/SE

Sec 30,T9S-R19E
Uintah County, UT

of Slickwater and YF 118 ST. ATP 7096psi at 48.2 BPM. ISIP 4540
psi. Flowed well overnight on a 10,12,14/64 ck for 8 hrs and made
812BF. TR-1303. BLWTR-3594 DC 44,124 CC-$1,523,374

10/29/04 RU Wellserv, set a 10K FTFP at 11050'. Gun failed, POOH and GIH
with new gun and perforated Stage 3 10903'-907', 10931'-933',
10960'-962', l1030'-034' 3SPF. RU SLB (Bakersfield) Break down
Stage 3 with 5730psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 27 holes open.
ISIP 4250psi. Hybrid frac with 114,208# of 20-40 SBXL sand using
2894 Bbls of Slickwater and YF 118ST fluid. ATP 7239psi at 50 BPM.
ISIP 4600psi. Flow well back for 4 hrs. RU Wellserve and set a 10K
FTFP at 10742'. Perforate Stage 4 Mesaverde 10580'-584', 10630'-
632', 10643'-645', 10690'-692", 10722'-726' 3 SPF. (JDL) DC$34068
CC-$1,557,442

10/30/04 Flowed well a total of 22 hrs and made 1807 BF. TR-3110. BLWTR-
4681. FFP 3100psi on a 14/64 ck. RU SLB PS(Bakersfield). Broke
Stage 4 with 5890psi. Perform reverse step rate test. ISIP 4050psi. 25
holes open.Hybrid Frac Stage 4 Mesaverde with 131,310# of 20-40
SBXL sand using 3351 Bbls of Slickwater and YF 118ST gell. ATP
6567 at 50 BPM. ISIP-3950psi. Turned well at 10:40AM with a 10/64
ek. Flowed well 20 hrs on a 12&l4/64 ck and made 2043BF, TR-
5153BF, BLWTR-5989. FFP-3000psi on a 14/64ck. Frac cost-
$473,204.CC- $2,030,646(JDL)

10/31/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 2043
bbls. TR 5153. BLWTR 5989. (SCE)

11/1/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 1443
bbls. TR 6596. BLWTR 4546. (SCE)DC-$11,850 CC-$2,042,496

11/2/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @2400 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 890
bbls. TR 7496. BLWTR 3646. (SCE)

11/4/04 Fin RIH w/ tbg. RU power swivel and drill up kill plug 10490'.
Drilled up FTFP's @l1050', l1310', l1457'. Cleaned well out to
PBTD @l1457'. LD 29 jts and landed tbg @10534' w/ 327 jts. ND
BOPE. NU tree. Pumped bit sub off. Put well back on flowback for
night. SDFN. (KF w/ Premier). DC 7430

11/5/04 Well flowed up csg for 14 hrs. Made 745 bbls w/ 1250 on 15/64" ck.
TR 9191. BLWTR 2056.

C:\DOCUME~1\OGMUSER\LOCALS~1\Temp\Federal 43-30-9-19 (Lightning
Rod).doc

Page 2 of



Federal 43-30-9-19
NEISE

Sec 30,T9S-R19E
Uintah County, UT

11/6/04 Well flowed up csg for 10 hrs. Made 405 bbls w/ 1250 on 16/64" ck.
TR 9596. BLWTR 1651. Shut well in to put du line. Natco fired up
sep. Fd plates on back of tks off. Will replace and put well dn line
tomorrow AM. Left well SI for night. (SCE)

11/7/04 Turned well over to pumper (Scott McKinnon) for turn on to Sales.
(SCE)

2"" Mohe - Complete Upper Mesaverde and Wasatch

9/1/05 MIRU Temples WS. Quickkill well and ND wellhead. NU BOPE.
POOH w/ 130 jts tby. Csg open to sales for night. (Rick w/ Premier)
DC 6057 CCC (2" Mobe) 6057

9/2/05 Quickkill and fin POOH. RIH w/ 3 ¾" bit and scraper to 10310'.
Start OOH. SLB cancelled frac. SD and left tbg in hole, landed @
9478'. Put well back on line to sales until frac is rescheduled. DC
5808 CCC $11865
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D ouc o Com P

From: "Tony Sharp" <tsharp@gascoenergy.com>

To: "Dustin Doucet" <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Date: 10/21/2005 4:11:27 PM
Subject: Sundry to Commingle

re: Federal 43-30-9-19, API #4304735494 3r¯g y
Federal 41-31-9-19, API # 4304735624

Dustin,

I have submitted Sundry Notices for comminglingon the subject
properties in the last few days. I inadvertently omitted as to how we
plan to allocate production. If required, the method used to account for
and to allocate production from each pool so commingled willbe by
individual interval hydrocarbon pore volume calculation.

Regards,

Tony Sharp
Senior Engineer
Gasco Production Company
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Englewood, CO 80012
tsharp@gascoenergy.com
Direct: 303-996-1823
Main: 303-483-0044
Cell:

D ouc o Com P

From: "Tony Sharp" <tsharp@gascoenergy.com>

To: "Dustin Doucet" <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Date: 10/21/2005 4:11:27 PM
Subject: Sundry to Commingle

re: Federal 43-30-9-19, API #4304735494 3r¯g y
Federal 41-31-9-19, API # 4304735624

Dustin,

I have submitted Sundry Notices for comminglingon the subject
properties in the last few days. I inadvertently omitted as to how we
plan to allocate production. If required, the method used to account for
and to allocate production from each pool so commingled willbe by
individual interval hydrocarbon pore volume calculation.

Regards,

Tony Sharp
Senior Engineer
Gasco Production Company
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Englewood, CO 80012
tsharp@gascoenergy.com
Direct: 303-996-1823
Main: 303-483-0044
Cell:

D ouc o Com P

From: "Tony Sharp" <tsharp@gascoenergy.com>

To: "Dustin Doucet" <dustindoucet@utah.gov>

Date: 10/21/2005 4:11:27 PM
Subject: Sundry to Commingle

re: Federal 43-30-9-19, API #4304735494 3r¯g y
Federal 41-31-9-19, API # 4304735624

Dustin,

I have submitted Sundry Notices for comminglingon the subject
properties in the last few days. I inadvertently omitted as to how we
plan to allocate production. If required, the method used to account for
and to allocate production from each pool so commingled willbe by
individual interval hydrocarbon pore volume calculation.

Regards,

Tony Sharp
Senior Engineer
Gasco Production Company
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100
Englewood, CO 80012
tsharp@gascoenergy.com
Direct: 303-996-1823
Main: 303-483-0044
Cell:



Form 31 5 UN STATES FORMAPPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Ep Z3l',007

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseSerialNo
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 676 32246

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian,Allotteeor TribeName
abandoned well. Use Form 3160 - 3 (APD) for such proposals NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unitor CA/Agreement,Nameand/or No.

1. Type of
il Well Gas Well Other 8.

WNe

INameand Na
Federal 43-30-9-192. NameofOperator GASco PRODUCTlON COMPANY 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) 4304735404 Sff
_¶

8 INVERNESS DR. E, # 100, ENGLEWOOD, CO 80112 303-483-0044 10.Fieldand Pool,or ExploratoryArea
4 Locationof Well (Footage,Sec , T, R.,M, or SmvevDescription) PARI ETTE BENCH

1980' FSL & 659' FEL (NESE) Sec.30-T9S-RI9E, SLM I l. Countyor Parish, State

UINTAH, UTAH

12. CHECK APPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TO INDICATE NATURE OF NGDCE, REPORT, OR OTHERDATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) WaterShut-Off
Noticeof Intent AlterCasing FractureTreal Reclamation Wellintegrity

SubsequentRepon Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other
ChangePlans PlugandAbandon TemporarilyAbandon

FinalAbandonmentNotice Convertto hijection PlugBack WaterDisposal

I3. DescribeProposedor CompletedOperation(clearlystateall pertinentdetails,includingestimatedstaningdateof anyproposedwork and approximatedurationthereof
If the proposalis todeependirectionallyor recomplete horizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasuredand truevertical depthsof all peninentmarkers and zones.
Attach the Bondunder which thework will be performedor providethe BondNo. on filewith BLM/BIA. Requiredsubsequentreponsshallbe filedwithin 30days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If theoperationresultsina multiple completion or recompletion ina new interval,a Form3160-4shallbe filedonce
testinghas beencompleted. FinalAbandonmentNoticesshallbe filedonly after all requirements, includingreclamation, havebeencompleted, and theoperator has
determinedthatthesite is ready forfinalinspection.)

Current Status: Producing from Lower Mesaverde
Paris: 10580-84, 10630-62', 10643-45'10690-92', 10722.26', 10903-07', 10931-33', 10960-62', 11030-34', 11182-84'. 11194-96', 11229-31', 11268-71', 11291-93'. 11375-77', 11410-16',
11432-36'

Scheduled Operation: Recomplete in Upper Mesaverde and Wasatch, commingle with existing production. Perforate and frac the following intervals:
Upper Mesaverde: 9067-9073'. 9261-9267'. 9730-9736', 10116-10120'.
Wasatch: 6974-6979'. 7048-7053', 7676-7681', 7748-7752', 7807-7811', 7602-8608', 8708-8714'

Estimated Start Date: October 19, 2005
Estimate Duration of Work; 7 Days

No new surface disturbance is anticipated. If any is necessary, prior approval will be obtained from the BLM-Vernal Field Office.

Gasco Production Company is the owner of all contiguous oil and gas leases or drilling units overlying the pools. and does herewith waive it's right to the 15-day period of objection per
UDOGM Rule 649-3-22(3). Gasco respectfully requests that the Division thereforeaccept this NOI in lieu of the required affidavit with regard to notification of the aforementioned owners.

Attachment: Exhibit showing the location of all wells on contiguous oil and gas lease or drilling units ovedying the subject pools.

14. Iherebycertifythattheforegoingistrucandcorrect
Name (Printed/Typed)

Signature

atee SENIOR ENGINEE

0/19/2005

THIS SPACÑOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved i Snn Dat

40

Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached. Approvalof this notice does not warrant or
GSS and Minmg

certify that the applicantholds legalor equitable title to those rights in the subject lease ,-

which would entitlethe applicant to conduct operations thercon. L
Title 18U.S.C.Section1001and Title43U.S.C.Section1212,make it a crime for aný4) k or agency of the United
Statesany false,fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to anymatterwithin its ju dic o

ULT1 4 2005(Instructions on page 2)

DN,OF0\L,GAS&
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O O
Federal 43-30-9-19 RECEIVED

NE/SE
Sec 30,T9S-R19E NOVO12005

f eb O
Uintah County, UT DIV.0F01L,GAS&MlNING

Federal 43-30-9-19 (Lightning Rod)

Build loc
3' ØŸ¾ 353 Ÿ3

5/?/04 Huffman Enterprises on loc to build rd and loc. DC $ CWC $

5/15/04 Water Service and Supply on loc to line pit. DC $9780 CWC

Set 13 3/8" conductor

6/6/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout Svc rig to spud well. Drill dn and set 16"
conductor. Drill to 240'. RIH w/ 13 3/8", 54.50#, J-55 csg and set @
240' GL. RU Big 4 and cmt csg back to surface w/ 260 sx Class "G" neat
cmt @15.6 ppg.

6/7/04 Drill out and drill dn to 800' GL. RDMOL. DC $35,100 CWC _.

6/8/04 Start filling reserve pit w/ wtr.

Completion

10/23/04 Frac tks filled w/ 2% Kcl. CC-$1,370,252

10/25/04 Tk battery 50 % complete. DC 6258 CC$ 1,376,510

10/26/04 RU Weatherford Wellserv Wireline. Ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray log.
RU Doublejack testing and tested esg to 8500 psi and held for 15 min, ok.
Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11375 - 77, 11410 - 16, 11432 - 36', 3 spf w/ 3
1/8" slick gun, 19 gm chgs, .47 EHD, 19" pen. All shots fired. RDMOL
and move to State 7-36A. (SCE) DC $1740CC$ 1,378,250

10/27/04 MI Weatherford Wellserv Wireline for tomorrows frac. Complete tank
battery. DC-$101,000(facilities) CC$1,479,250

10/28/04 RU SLB Pumping Services (Bakersfield). Break down Stage 1 Mesaverde
with 5483psi. Perform reverse step rate test with Slickwater and Clay frac.
ISIP 4725psi, 25 holes open. Frac Stage 1 with 74,853# of 20-40 SBXL
using 2388 bbls of Slickwater and YF118st gell. ATP 6977psi at 50 BPM.
ISIP 4750 psi. Turned well on a 10,12,14/64 ck and cleaned up for 6hrs
and made 491 BF. FFP 3500psi. RU Wellserv and set a 10K FTFP at
11310'. Perforated Mesaverde Stage 2 f/ 11,182 - 84', 11,194 - 96',
l1,229 - 31', 11,268 - 71', l1,291 - 93', 3 spf as above. Break down
Stage 2 with 5759psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 20 holes open. ISIP
4500psi. Hybrid Frac with 87475# of 20-40 SBXL sand, using 2508 bb1s
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O O
Federal 43-30-9-19

NE/SE
Sec 30,T9S-R19E

Uintah County, UT

of Slickwater and YF 118 ST. ATP 7096psi at 48.2 BPM. ISIP 4540 psi.
Flowed well overnight on a 10,12,14/64 ck for 8 hrs and made 812BF.
TR-1303. BLWTR-3594 DC 44,124 CC-$1,523,374

10/29/04 RU Wellserv, set a 10K FTFP at 11050'. Gun failed, POOH and GIH with
new gun and perforated Stage 3 10903'-907', 10931'-933', 10960'-962',
l1030'-034' 3SPF. RU SLB (Bakersfield) Break down Stage 3 with
5730psi. Perform reverse step rate test, 27 holes open. ISIP 4250psi.
Hybrid frac with 114,208# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2894 Bbls of
Slickwater and YF 118ST fluid. ATP 7239psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4600psi.
Flow well back for 4 hrs. RU Wellserve and set a 10K FTFP at 10742'.
Perforate Stage 4 Mesaverde 10580'-584', 10630'-632', 10643'-645',
10690'-692", 10722'-726' 3 SPF. (JDL) DC$34068 CC-$1,557,442

10/30/04 Flowed well a total of 22 hrs and made 1807 BF. TR-3110. BLWTR-
4681. FFP 3100psi on a 14/64 ck. RU SLB PS(Bakersfield). Broke Stage
4 with 5890psi. Perform reverse step rate test. ISIP 4050psi. 25 holes
open.Hybrid Frac Stage 4 Mesaverde with 131,310# of 20-40 SBXL sand
using 3351 Bbls of Slickwater and YF l18ST gell. ATP 6567 at 50 BPM.
ISIP-3950psi. Turned well at 10:40AM with a 10/64 ck. Flowed well 20
hrs on a 12&l4/64 ck and made 2043BF, TR-5153BF, BLWTR-5989.
FFP-3000psi on a 14/64ck. Frac cost-$473,204. CC- $2,030,646(JDL)

10/31/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 2043 bbls.
TR 5153. BLWTR 5989. (SCE)

11/1/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @3000 FCP on 14/64" ek. Made 1443 bbls.
TR 6596. BLWTR 4546. (SCE)DC-$11,850 CC-$2,042,496

11/2/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing back @2400 FCP on 14/64" ck. Made 890 bbls.
TR 7496. BLWTR 3646. (SCE)

11/4/04 Fin RIH w/ tbg. RU power swivel and drill up kill plug 10490'. Drilled
up FTFP's @ l1050', 11310', 11457'. Cleaned well out to PBTD @
11457'. LD 29 jts and landed tbg @10534' w/ 327 jts. ND BOPE. NU
tree. Pumped bit sub off. Put well back on flowback for night. SDFN.
(KF w/ Premier). DC 7430

11/5/04 Well flowed up esg for 14 hrs. Made 745 bbls w/ 1250 on 15/64" ck. TR
9191. BLWTR 2056.
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O O
Federal 43-30-9-19

NE/SE
Sec 30,T9S-R19E

Uintah County, UT

11/6/04 Well flowed up csg for 10 hrs. Made 405 bbls w/ 1250 on 16/64" ck. TR
9596. BLWTR 1651. Shut well in to put dn line. Natco fired up sep. Fd
plates on back of tks off. Will replace and put well dn line tomorrow AM.
Left well SI for night. (SCE)

11/7/04 Turned well over to pumper (Scott McKinnon) for turn on to Sales. (SCE)

2"" Mobe - Complete Upper Mesaverde and Wasatch

9/1/05 MIRU Temples WS. Quickkill well and ND wellhead. NU BOPE.
POOH w/ 130 jts tbg. Csg open to sales for night. (Rick w/ Premier). DC
6057 CCC (2ndMobe) 6057

9/2/05 Quickkill and fin POOH. RIH w/ 3 ¾" bit and scraper to 10310'. Start
OOH. SLB cancelled frac. SD and left tbg in hole, landed @9478'. Put
well back on line to sales until frac is rescheduled. DC 5808 CCC
$11865

9/14/05 Resume POOH and LD tbg. Came OOH without bit and scraper on tbg.
Steel pinned POBS inadvertently pumped off. SDFN. DC 5200 CCC
$17,065.

9/15/05 RIH w/ 3 ¾" overshot (dressed for 3 1/16" catch) + bumper sub + 2 3/8"
tbg. Stacked out on fish @11160' (probably scale or sd bridge). POOH
and SB tbg. Came out with entire fish. RIH and POOH and LD tbg.
SDFN. (Kelly w/ Premier) DC 8350 CCC $25,415

9/16/05 Fin POOH and LD tbg. ND BOPE. NU frac tree and test. RDMOL.
(Kelly w/ Premier)

10/19/05 MIRU SLB Wireline to perf. RIH w/ 3 5/8" gauge ring and junk basket to
10250'. Never hit any obstructions. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 5
- Upper Mesaverde. Set Baker 12.5K Comp BP #1 @10135'. Perforated
f/ 9730 - 36', 10116 - 20', 3 spf w/ 3 1/8" Hi-vol guns, 120 deg phased.
(CR)

10/20/05 RU SLB (Red crew- Shawn and Mike) to frac. Found 0 psi on esg.
Loaded hole w/ 127 bbls. Broke dn perfs @4000 psi @5.3 bpm. ISIP
3900. FG .83 Cale 23 holes open / 30. Hybrid fraced Stg 5 w/ 65552#
20-40 Temp DC+, using 2253 bbls WF and YF 118 gel. Flushed csg w/
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143 bb1s. ISIP 4000. FG .84. Opened well to FB @ l 1:45 AM, on
12/64" ck w/ 4000 SICP. Cleaned up and SI to perf. RIH w/ plug and
guns to perf Stage 6 - Upper Mesaverde / Dark Canyon. Set FTFP #2 @
9282'. Perforated f/ 9067 - 73', 9261 - 67', 3 spf. Fd 3630 SICP. Broke
dn perfs @4802 psi @5.3 bpm. ISIP 2980. FG .76. Cale 21 holes open
/ 36. Hybrid fraced w/ 78900# 20-40 Temp LC and 38700# Temp DC+,
using 3028 bbls WF and YF 118 gel. Flushed w/ 133.3 bbls. ISIP 3640.
FG .84. Opened well up to FB @5:15 PM, on 12/64" ck, w/ 3700 SICP.
(SCE)

10/21/05 SWI @6:45 AM w/ 1750 FCP on 16/64" ck. Fld 1511 bbls in 16 hrs. TR
1511. BLWTR 3770. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 7 - Wasatch.
Set FTFP #3 @8729'. Perforated f/ 8602 - 08', 8708 - 14', 3 spf. RU
red crew to frac. Broke dn perfs @4946 psi @5.2 bpm. ISIP 3300. FG
.82. Calc 27 holes open. Hybrid fraced Stg 7 w/ 72718# 20-40 TLC,
using 2076 bbls WF and YF 118 gel. Flushed w/ 126.3 bb1s. ISIP 3560.
FG .85. Opened well to FB @9:30 AM on 12/64 " ck, w/ 3650 SICP.
RIH w/ "Perf only" gun and shot 7986 - 94'. RIH w/ plug and guns to
perf Stage 8 - Wasatch. Set FTFP #4 @7826'. Perforated f/ 7676 - 81',
7748 - 52', 7807 - 1l', 3 spf. Found 2200 psi SICP (less than before
perforating, must have cross flowed into new perfs). Broke dn perfs @
3000 psi @15 bpm. ISIP 2250. FG .73. Calc 27 holes open / 39. Hybrid
fraced Stg 8 w/ 69205# 20-40 reg sd and 27500# 20-40 TLC, using 2228
bb1sWF and YF 118 gel. Flushed esg w/ 112.5 bb1s. ISIP 2140. FG .71.

Opened well up to FB @3:30 PM on 12/64" ck w/ 2200 SICP. (SCE and
CR).

10/22/05 SWI @6:30 AM w/ 1200 FCP on 16/64" ek. Made 919 bb1s in 17 hrs.
TR 2430. BLWTR 7155. RIH w/ plug and guns to perforate Stage 9 -
Mesaverde. Set FTFP #5 @7070'. Perforated 6974 - 79', 7048 - 53', 3
spf. Fd 1250 SICP. Broke dn perfs @3251 psi @10.6 bpm. Calc 29
holes open / 30. ISIP 1300. FG .62. Gel fraced w/ 97085# 20-40 sd and
18091# TLC, using 1628bbls YF 118 gel. Crew is convinced that all sand
was here, and was pumped down hole. Job showed 21,000# short on
sand. Must have been off on density. Flushed w/ 102 bbls. ISIP 1160.
FG .60. Opened well to FB @9:25 AM on 14/64" ck w/ 1250. Cleaned
up and SI to perforate "Perf Only" zones. (SCE and CR) DC $555,061
CCC $580,476(2nd Mobe)

10/23/05 Well flowing this AM w/ 950 FCP on 16/64" ck. Made 863 bbls in 20.5
hrs. TR 3293. BLWTR 7920. (SCE)

10/24/05 Well flowing this AM w/ 1225 FCP on 16/64 ck. Made 640 bbls in 24 hrs.
TR 3933 bb1s,BLWTR 7280 bbls. ( CR)
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Uintah County, UT

10/25/05 Well flowing this AM «I 1275 psi on 16/64 ck. Made 504 bbls in 24
hrs. TR 5002 bbls, BLWTR 6211 bbls. Well still making 21 BPH, to
much for separator to handle. Unable to turn down line.

10/26/05 Well flowing this AM w/ 1225 psi on 16/64 ck. Made 409 bbls in 24
hrs. TR 5411 bbls, BLWTR 5802. Well flowing @15 BPH split stream
and turn down line. (CR)

10/28/05 Move over and rig up service rig, Well flowing @ 1200 psi, Pump 50
Bbls down CSG, NDWH and NU BOP. Pick up 3 ¾ bit and pump off
bit sub, Start in hole w/ 2 3/8 TBG . Shut down for night with TBG @
6000'. Leave well open down sales line. DC$ 6262.00 CCC $586,738
(Rick w/ Premier)(CR)

10/29/05 Fd 1200 FCP. Continued to RIH w/ 2 3/8" tbg. Tag FTFP #5 @
7070'. RU power swivel and Maverick N2. Drill up plug in 7 min,
using water (no N2). RIH and tagged plug #4 @ 7826'. Drilled up
remainder of 1'' plug and #4 in 20 min. RIH and tagged #3 @8729'.
Drilled up in 30 min. RIH and tagged #2 @9268'. Fd 14' of sd fill on
this plug. Circ dn and drilled for 1 hr. Cire cln and pulled up 30',
still using water only. SDFN and left well flowing back for night. Put
well thru sep @ 4:00 AM. DC 15838 CCC $602,576 (Rick w/
Premier) (SCE)

10/30/05 Well flowing back this AM (thru sep), w/ 1150 FCP on 16/64" ck.
Made 136 bbls (above load). TR 5578. BLWTR 5635. Tagged plug
#2, and fell thrn. RIH and tagged 12.5K Comp plug #1 @ 10135'.
Started N2 and cire top of plug clean. Drilled up plug and lost circ.
Pulled up and continued to cire w/ N2. Regained circ in +_30 min.
Finished drilling up plug. RIH to 11160'and tagged scale plug.
Drilled up rest of plug 1 debris, and scale plug in +.. 3'. Fell thru.
RIH and tagged another plug @11347'. Drilled a little, and fell thrn.
Fin RIH and tagged PBTD @ 11457'. Circ cln w/ N2. Start POOH
and LD tbg. SDFN. DC 19139 CCC $621,715

10/31/05 Fd 1150 FCP. POOH and LD 26 more jts. Landed tbg @9510' KB w/
295 jts. ND BOP's. NU prod tree. Broached tbg to SN. Dropped ball
and pumped off bit sub w/ 200 psi. RDMOL. (SCE) DC 3807 CCC
$625,522
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Form 3\60-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. Lease Serial No.

UTU-37246

Ia. Type of well O Oil Well Gas O Dry Other 6. If indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: New Work Deepen Plug Back Diff Resvr. NA

Other SA 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

NA
2. Narne of Operator 8. I.ease Narne and Well No.
Gasco Production Company Federal 43-30-9-19
3. Address 3a. Phone No. (include area code)

8 Inverness I)rive East Suile 100 Englewood. Colorado 80112 303-483-0044
9. API Well No.

4. 1.ocation of Well (Report locations clear/v and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

At surface 1980' FSL & 659' FEL (NESI ) Riverbend
I l. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and

At top prod. interval reported below Same surveyor Area see 3o-Tes-RivE
12. County or Parish 13. State

At total depth Same Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed d-Sj-- G 17. Elevations (DF. RKB, RT, GL)*

O Da^ E Readytorroa.
06/06/04 09/19/04 4828' KB / 48 10' Ol

10/23/04
18 Total Depth. MD I 1610 19. Plug Back T.D. MD l 1457 20. Depth l ridge Plug Set: MD

TVD ||6]() TVD 11457 TVD
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22. Was well cored? No O Yes(Submit copy)

Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)

FDC'/CNI,/GR/SP: GIUCCL/CBL/V DI. I)irectional Survey? No O Yes (Submit copy)

23. Casing and I.iner Record (Report all strings set in weH)
Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & SIurry Vol.

I lole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/11.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD' Cement Top* Amount Pulled
Depth Type of Cement (881.)

17 1/2" 13 3/8 J-55 54.4# Surtlice 221 260 ss of Class (i Surface
12 \/4" 8 5/8 M-5 28# Surlace 3622 635 sx liitifi & 260 sx of 10-2 RFC Surlace

7 7/8" 4 I/2"I'l 10 13 5# Surilice i1528 500 sx Hitill & 1650 sx of 50-50 Por Surflice
24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) acker Depth (MD Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Sei (MD) Packer Set (MD)

2 3/8" | 9507
25. Producing Intervals .:nnoin I..o M/u-ial vil.ninanon sla el 26. Perforation Record

Forrnation Top Rottom Perforated Interval Size No. Iloles Perf Status
Mesaverde 10580 11436 Il432-36,11410-16;Il375-77: .47EllD 36 Open

I1291-93; I1268-71: I1229-31: .47 EHD 21 Open
11194-96; Il l82-84: ll030-34: .-17 FIID 24 Open
10960-62, 10931-33, 10903-07, .47 EllD 24 Open

10722-26. 10690-92: 10643-45. 10630-32; 10580-84 .47 EHD 42 Open
27 Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cernent Squeeze, Etc. d unania rl u a.!</na:n,:/ loon.uion A , o

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material

I I 375-436 74,853# of 20-40 SBXI. sand, using 2.388 bbis of Slickwater and YF I I8s! gel RECEIVED
ll 182-293 87.475# of 20-40 SilXI. sand. using 2,508 bbis of Slickwater and YF I 18st gel

10903-11034 I 14,208# of20-40 SBXL sand, using 2.894 bbis of Slickwater and YF l 18s! gci NOVI 6 2005
10580-726 131,310# of 20-40 SBXI sand. using 3,35 I bb1s of Slickwater and YF I 1881gel

28. Production - Interval A
(Tonnnuedon anachedsheet DIVOFOll.,CAD&MitgG

Date Firs! Test f lours Test Oil Gas Waler Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Productio BBL MCF 881. Corr. API Gravity

I 1/05/04 l 1/07/04 24 4 5 1,069 67 Flowing
Choke Tyg press Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Waler Oil Gravity Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BRI, Corr API

10/64" SI 1950 2550 9 5 1069 67 On Production
28a.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Dale Tested Productio BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBl. MCF BBL Corr. API

SI

(See instructions and spaces for additiona/ d<Wa on reverse

O O
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I I 375-436 74,853# of 20-40 SBXI. sand, using 2.388 bbis of Slickwater and YF I I8s! gel RECEIVED
ll 182-293 87.475# of 20-40 SilXI. sand. using 2,508 bbis of Slickwater and YF I 18st gel

10903-11034 I 14,208# of20-40 SBXL sand, using 2.894 bbis of Slickwater and YF l 18s! gci NOVI 6 2005
10580-726 131,310# of 20-40 SBXI sand. using 3,35 I bb1s of Slickwater and YF I 1881gel

28. Production - Interval A
(Tonnnuedon anachedsheet DIVOFOll.,CAD&MitgG

Date Firs! Test f lours Test Oil Gas Waler Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Productio BBL MCF 881. Corr. API Gravity

I 1/05/04 l 1/07/04 24 4 5 1,069 67 Flowing
Choke Tyg press Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Waler Oil Gravity Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BRI, Corr API

10/64" SI 1950 2550 9 5 1069 67 On Production
28a.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Dale Tested Productio BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBl. MCF BBL Corr. API

SI

(See instructions and spaces for additiona/ d<Wa on reverse

O O
Form 3\60-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. Lease Serial No.

UTU-37246

Ia. Type of well O Oil Well Gas O Dry Other 6. If indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: New Work Deepen Plug Back Diff Resvr. NA

Other SA 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.

NA
2. Narne of Operator 8. I.ease Narne and Well No.
Gasco Production Company Federal 43-30-9-19
3. Address 3a. Phone No. (include area code)

8 Inverness I)rive East Suile 100 Englewood. Colorado 80112 303-483-0044
9. API Well No.

4. 1.ocation of Well (Report locations clear/v and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

At surface 1980' FSL & 659' FEL (NESI ) Riverbend
I l. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and

At top prod. interval reported below Same surveyor Area see 3o-Tes-RivE
12. County or Parish 13. State

At total depth Same Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed d-Sj-- G 17. Elevations (DF. RKB, RT, GL)*

O Da^ E Readytorroa.
06/06/04 09/19/04 4828' KB / 48 10' Ol

10/23/04
18 Total Depth. MD I 1610 19. Plug Back T.D. MD l 1457 20. Depth l ridge Plug Set: MD

TVD ||6]() TVD 11457 TVD
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy ofeach) 22. Was well cored? No O Yes(Submit copy)

Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit copy)

FDC'/CNI,/GR/SP: GIUCCL/CBL/V DI. I)irectional Survey? No O Yes (Submit copy)

23. Casing and I.iner Record (Report all strings set in weH)
Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & SIurry Vol.

I lole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/11.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD' Cement Top* Amount Pulled
Depth Type of Cement (881.)

17 1/2" 13 3/8 J-55 54.4# Surtlice 221 260 ss of Class (i Surface

12 \/4" 8 5/8 M-5 28# Surlace 3622 635 sx liitifi & 260 sx of 10-2 RFC Surlace

7 7/8" 4 I/2"I'l 10 13 5# Surilice i1528 500 sx Hitill & 1650 sx of 50-50 Por Surflice
24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) acker Depth (MD Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Sei (MD) Packer Set (MD)

2 3/8" | 9507
25. Producing Intervals .:nnoin I..o M/u-ial vil.ninanon sla el 26. Perforation Record

Forrnation Top Rottom Perforated Interval Size No. Iloles Perf Status
Mesaverde 10580 11436 Il432-36,11410-16;Il375-77: .47EllD 36 Open

I1291-93; I1268-71: I1229-31: .47 EHD 21 Open
11194-96; Il l82-84: ll030-34: .-17 FIID 24 Open
10960-62, 10931-33, 10903-07, .47 EllD 24 Open

10722-26. 10690-92: 10643-45. 10630-32; 10580-84 .47 EHD 42 Open
27 Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cernent Squeeze, Etc. d unania rl u a.!</na:n,:/ loon.uion A , o

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material

I I 375-436 74,853# of 20-40 SBXI. sand, using 2.388 bbis of Slickwater and YF I I8s! gel RECEIVED
ll 182-293 87.475# of 20-40 SilXI. sand. using 2,508 bbis of Slickwater and YF I 18st gel

10903-11034 I 14,208# of20-40 SBXL sand, using 2.894 bbis of Slickwater and YF l 18s! gci NOVI 6 2005
10580-726 131,310# of 20-40 SBXI sand. using 3,35 I bb1s of Slickwater and YF I 1881gel

28. Production - Interval A
(Tonnnuedon anachedsheet DIVOFOll.,CAD&MitgG

Date Firs! Test f lours Test Oil Gas Waler Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Productio BBL MCF 881. Corr. API Gravity

I 1/05/04 l 1/07/04 24 4 5 1,069 67 Flowing
Choke Tyg press Csg 24 Hr. Oil Gas Waler Oil Gravity Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BRI, Corr API

10/64" SI 1950 2550 9 5 1069 67 On Production
28a.
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Dale Tested Productio BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas water Oil Gravity Well Status
Size Flwg. Press Rate BBl. MCF BBL Corr. API

SI

(See instructions and spaces for additiona/ d<Wa on reverse



O O
28b.
Date First Test f lours Tes! Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Dale Tesied Production BBL MCF BBl. Corr. API

10/25/05 11/02/05 24 12 976 85 I lowing
Choke Tbg. Press Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Waler Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rale BRI. MCF BBL Ratio

16/64" Si 12 976 85 Producing nomA & B
28c. Production - Interval E
Date Firs! Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravily Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Produc on BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 lh Oil Gas Water Gas Oil Well Stalus
Size Flwg Press Rate BBl. MCF BBL Ratio

si
29. Disposition of Gas (S<>Idused forfliet vented etc.)

Sold
30. Summary of Porous Zones (include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time 1001open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoverics.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas. Depth

Uinta 0 5.237

Wasatch 5,238 9.042

Mesaverde 9,043 I I,506

Castlegate I 1,057 TD well within the Castlegate @ 11,610'

32. Additional remarks (include plugging proce< ure)

33. Circle enclosed attachments:

I. Electrical/Mechanical I.ogs (I full set reg'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other;

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and allached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) Beverly Walker Title Engineering Technician

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

o U.S. GPO:

O O
28b.
Date First Test f lours Tes! Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Dale Tesied Production BBL MCF BBl. Corr. API

10/25/05 11/02/05 24 12 976 85 I lowing
Choke Tbg. Press Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Waler Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rale BRI. MCF BBL Ratio

16/64" Si 12 976 85 Producing nomA & B
28c. Production - Interval E
Date Firs! Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravily Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Produc on BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 lh Oil Gas Water Gas Oil Well Stalus
Size Flwg Press Rate BBl. MCF BBL Ratio

si
29. Disposition of Gas (S<>Idused forfliet vented etc.)

Sold
30. Summary of Porous Zones (include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time 1001open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoverics.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas. Depth

Uinta 0 5.237

Wasatch 5,238 9.042

Mesaverde 9,043 I I,506

Castlegate I 1,057 TD well within the Castlegate @ 11,610'

32. Additional remarks (include plugging proce< ure)

33. Circle enclosed attachments:

I. Electrical/Mechanical I.ogs (I full set reg'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other;

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and allached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) Beverly Walker Title Engineering Technician

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

o U.S. GPO:

O O
28b.
Date First Test f lours Tes! Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Dale Tesied Production BBL MCF BBl. Corr. API

10/25/05 11/02/05 24 12 976 85 I lowing
Choke Tbg. Press Csg 24 Hr Oil Gas Waler Gas : Oil Well Status
Size FIwg. Press. Rale BRI. MCF BBL Ratio

16/64" Si 12 976 85 Producing nomA & B
28c. Production - Interval E
Date Firs! Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravily Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Produc on BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 lh Oil Gas Water Gas Oil Well Stalus
Size Flwg Press Rate BBl. MCF BBL Ratio

si
29. Disposition of Gas (S<>Idused forfliet vented etc.)

Sold
30. Summary of Porous Zones (include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time 1001open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoverics.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas. Depth

Uinta 0 5.237

Wasatch 5,238 9.042

Mesaverde 9,043 I I,506

Castlegate I 1,057 TD well within the Castlegate @ 11,610'

32. Additional remarks (include plugging proce< ure)

33. Circle enclosed attachments:

I. Electrical/Mechanical I.ogs (I full set reg'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other;

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and allached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) Beverly Walker Title Engineering Technician

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

o U.S. GPO:



State 7-36A
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

25. Producing Intervals continued
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status

A. Mesaverde 9,067 10,120 10116-20:9730-36:926l-67:9067-73 .47EHD 66 Open
8708-14; 8602-08; 7986-94; 7807-11; 7748

B. Wasatch 6,974 8,714 52; 7676-81; 7048-53; 6974-79 .47 EHD 105 Open

27. Acid Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued)
Depth Interval Arnount and Type of Material
9730-10120 65,552# of20-40 Temp DC+ using 2,253 bbls WF & YF I 18 Gel
9067-9267 78,900# of20-40 Temp LC & 38,700# Temp DC+ using 3028 WF & YF \ 18 Gel
8602-8714 72.718# of20-40 Temp LC using2076 bbis WF& YF 118 Gel
7676-78 1I 69,205# of 20-40 Reg Sand & 27,500# of 20-40 Temp LC using 2228 bbls of WF & YF I 18 Gel
6974-7053 97,085# of 20-40 Sand & I8,09 I# Temp LC using I628 bbis YF I I8

State 7-36A
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

25. Producing Intervals continued
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status

A. Mesaverde 9,067 10,120 10116-20:9730-36:926l-67:9067-73 .47EHD 66 Open
8708-14; 8602-08; 7986-94; 7807-11; 7748

B. Wasatch 6,974 8,714 52; 7676-81; 7048-53; 6974-79 .47 EHD 105 Open

27. Acid Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued)
Depth Interval Arnount and Type of Material
9730-10120 65,552# of20-40 Temp DC+ using 2,253 bbls WF & YF I 18 Gel
9067-9267 78,900# of20-40 Temp LC & 38,700# Temp DC+ using 3028 WF & YF \ 18 Gel
8602-8714 72.718# of20-40 Temp LC using2076 bbis WF& YF 118 Gel
7676-78 1I 69,205# of 20-40 Reg Sand & 27,500# of 20-40 Temp LC using 2228 bbls of WF & YF I 18 Gel
6974-7053 97,085# of 20-40 Sand & I8,09 I# Temp LC using I628 bbis YF I I8

State 7-36A
Additional Information to Well Completion Report

25. Producing Intervals continued
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status

A. Mesaverde 9,067 10,120 10116-20:9730-36:926l-67:9067-73 .47EHD 66 Open
8708-14; 8602-08; 7986-94; 7807-11; 7748

B. Wasatch 6,974 8,714 52; 7676-81; 7048-53; 6974-79 .47 EHD 105 Open

27. Acid Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc (continued)
Depth Interval Arnount and Type of Material
9730-10120 65,552# of20-40 Temp DC+ using 2,253 bbls WF & YF I 18 Gel
9067-9267 78,900# of20-40 Temp LC & 38,700# Temp DC+ using 3028 WF & YF \ 18 Gel
8602-8714 72.718# of20-40 Temp LC using2076 bbis WF& YF 118 Gel
7676-78 1I 69,205# of 20-40 Reg Sand & 27,500# of 20-40 Temp LC using 2228 bbls of WF & YF I 18 Gel
6974-7053 97,085# of 20-40 Sand & I8,09 I# Temp LC using I628 bbis YF I I8



Eorm3160-5 UNITE ATES
FORM APPROVE D

August 1999)
OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR rxpiresJoovember3o.2ooo

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. I ease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU 37246
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If1ndian,AllottecorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 {APD) for such proposals- NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse sIcŸO
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

Type of Well
NA

Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8. Well Name and No.

Name of Operator Federal 43-3o-ro-r8

Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-35343

8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T. R. M. or Survev Description; Riverbend
i 1. County or Parish, State

1 8 TSL & 659'FEL (NE SE) Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE REPORT.OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrily

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recompletc Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O i inal Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

if the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days

lollowing completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new intervaL a Form 3160A shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Nouces shall be filed only after all requirements. including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection

This is to iriform you that we will be disposing of waterkom this well as follows:

All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at Brennon Bottom

Water Disposal located between Roosevelt and Vernal Utah.
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
FORRECORDONLY

14. I hereby certify thafthe foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed//pÿed) Títfe

Beverh¡ Walker Engineering Technician
Signat r Date

«January 24, 2000

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

o Äit , s oi pp i si av y r atta ed ppro I of th sr >tice d a no rrant or Oflice
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable utie to those nghts in the subject lease

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thercon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States any

false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(In.\ttfittien;a<47ieverse)

RECElVED
FEB1O2006

DIVOFOIL,GAS&

Eorm3160-5 UNITE ATES
FORM APPROVE D

August 1999)
OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR rxpiresJoovember3o.2ooo

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. I ease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU 37246
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If1ndian,AllottecorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 {APD) for such proposals- NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse sIcŸO
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

Type of Well
NA

Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8. Well Name and No.

Name of Operator Federal 43-3o-ro-r8

Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-35343

8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T. R. M. or Survev Description; Riverbend
i 1. County or Parish, State

1 8 TSL & 659'FEL (NE SE) Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE REPORT.OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrily

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recompletc Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O i inal Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

if the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days

lollowing completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new intervaL a Form 3160A shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Nouces shall be filed only after all requirements. including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection

This is to iriform you that we will be disposing of waterkom this well as follows:

All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at Brennon Bottom

Water Disposal located between Roosevelt and Vernal Utah.
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
FORRECORDONLY

14. I hereby certify thafthe foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed//pÿed) Títfe

Beverh¡ Walker Engineering Technician
Signat r Date

«January 24, 2000

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

o Äit , s oi pp i si av y r atta ed ppro I of th sr >tice d a no rrant or Oflice
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable utie to those nghts in the subject lease

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thercon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States any

false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(In.\ttfittien;a<47ieverse)

RECElVED
FEB1O2006

DIVOFOIL,GAS&

Eorm3160-5 UNITE ATES
FORM APPROVE D

August 1999)
OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR rxpiresJoovember3o.2ooo

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. I ease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU 37246
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If1ndian,AllottecorTribeName

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 {APD) for such proposals- NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse sIcŸO
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

Type of Well
NA

Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8. Well Name and No.

Name of Operator Federal 43-3o-ro-r8

Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-35343

8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T. R. M. or Survev Description; Riverbend
i 1. County or Parish, State

1 8 TSL & 659'FEL (NE SE) Uintah County, Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE REPORT.OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) Water Shut-Off

Alter Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrily

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recompletc Other

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

O i inal Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

if the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days

lollowing completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new intervaL a Form 3160A shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Nouces shall be filed only after all requirements. including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site is ready for final inspection

This is to iriform you that we will be disposing of waterkom this well as follows:

All produced water fromthis well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at Brennon Bottom

Water Disposal located between Roosevelt and Vernal Utah.
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
FORRECORDONLY

14. I hereby certify thafthe foregoing is true and correct

Name (Printed//pÿed) Títfe

Beverh¡ Walker Engineering Technician
Signat r Date

«January 24, 2000

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

o Äit , s oi pp i si av y r atta ed ppro I of th sr >tice d a no rrant or Oflice
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable utie to those nghts in the subject lease

which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thercon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency ofthe United States any

false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(In.\ttfittien;a<47ieverse)

RECElVED
FEB1O2006

DIVOFOIL,GAS&



Form3160-s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

006"""* DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31.2007

5 Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned weH. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

1 TypeofWell NA
Oil well Gas Well Other 8 Well Name and No

2 Name ofOperalor Federal 43-30-9- 19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b PhoneNo unc/udearcaradel 43-047 444-
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 I 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool or Exploratory Area

4. I ocation of Well (Ecola, e. Sec.. T, IL AL or Surrer IJesenpnan) Pariette Bench
I 1 County or Parish. State

1980' FSL & 659' FEL NE SE of Section 30-T9S-RI9E
.

lJintah County, Utah
12. CIlliCK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATil NATilRE OF NOTICE. RIiPORT. OR OTilER DATA

TYPE OF SUllMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inleni Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shui-off

Altering Casing Fracture lical Reclamation Well lutegrily

Subsequeni Report Casmg kepaa New Constructron Recomplete Other

Change Plans Phip and abandon Temporanly Abandon EFM Meter

Final Abandonmeni Notice Conver11o Injechon Plug back Waler Disposal

13 Desenbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. meludmg estimated staiting dale of any proposed wrk and approximate duration therof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally. give subsurlace localions and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Ilond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with Ill.M/BIA Required subsu¡nent opons shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations if the operation results in a mulliple compleiion or ocompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(N4 shall be filed once
testing has been compleled Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operalor has
determined that the site is ready Ibr final inspection

77tis sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 3500) to measure production from this toell ural tvill be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. 77:is unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

APR2 62006

14 1 hereby cenify that the foregoing is true and corect
Name (Prmied 7)ped)

Title
Beverly Wplker Engineering Technician

l>aie
April 20, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approvat if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warant or
certify ihat the applicant holds legal or equilable title lo those nghts in the subicci lease Ollice
which would entitle the apphcant to conduct operations Ihereon

Title 18 U S.C Section 1001 AND Title 43 USC Section 1212 make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as 10 any matter within ils urisdiction

(Insmienons on page

Form3160-s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

006"""* DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31.2007

5 Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned weH. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

1 TypeofWell NA

Oil well Gas Well Other 8 Well Name and No

2 Name ofOperalor Federal 43-30-9- 19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b PhoneNo unc/udearcaradel 43-047 444-
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 I 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool or Exploratory Area

4. I ocation of Well (Ecola, e. Sec.. T, IL AL or Surrer IJesenpnan) Pariette Bench
I 1 County or Parish. State

1980' FSL & 659' FEL NE SE of Section 30-T9S-RI9E
.

lJintah County, Utah
12. CIlliCK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATil NATilRE OF NOTICE. RIiPORT. OR OTilER DATA

TYPE OF SUllMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inleni Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shui-off

Altering Casing Fracture lical Reclamation Well lutegrily

Subsequeni Report Casmg kepaa New Constructron Recomplete Other

Change Plans Phip and abandon Temporanly Abandon EFM Meter

Final Abandonmeni Notice Conver11o Injechon Plug back Waler Disposal

13 Desenbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. meludmg estimated staiting dale of any proposed wrk and approximate duration therof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally. give subsurlace localions and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Ilond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with Ill.M/BIA Required subsu¡nent opons shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations if the operation results in a mulliple compleiion or ocompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(N4 shall be filed once
testing has been compleled Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operalor has
determined that the site is ready Ibr final inspection

77tis sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 3500) to measure production from this toell ural tvill be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. 77:is unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

APR2 62006

14 1 hereby cenify that the foregoing is true and corect
Name (Prmied 7)ped)

Title
Beverly Wplker Engineering Technician

l>aie
April 20, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approvat if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warant or
certify ihat the applicant holds legal or equilable title lo those nghts in the subicci lease Ollice
which would entitle the apphcant to conduct operations Ihereon

Title 18 U S.C Section 1001 AND Title 43 USC Section 1212 make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as 10 any matter within ils urisdiction

(Insmienons on page

Form3160-s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

006"""* DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31.2007

5 Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned weH. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

1 TypeofWell NA

Oil well Gas Well Other 8 Well Name and No

2 Name ofOperalor Federal 43-30-9- 19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b PhoneNo unc/udearcaradel 43-047 444-
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 I 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool or Exploratory Area

4. I ocation of Well (Ecola, e. Sec.. T, IL AL or Surrer IJesenpnan) Pariette Bench
I 1 County or Parish. State

1980' FSL & 659' FEL NE SE of Section 30-T9S-RI9E
.

lJintah County, Utah
12. CIlliCK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATil NATilRE OF NOTICE. RIiPORT. OR OTilER DATA

TYPE OF SUllMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inleni Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shui-off

Altering Casing Fracture lical Reclamation Well lutegrily

Subsequeni Report Casmg kepaa New Constructron Recomplete Other

Change Plans Phip and abandon Temporanly Abandon EFM Meter

Final Abandonmeni Notice Conver11o Injechon Plug back Waler Disposal

13 Desenbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. meludmg estimated staiting dale of any proposed wrk and approximate duration therof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally. give subsurlace localions and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Ilond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with Ill.M/BIA Required subsu¡nent opons shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations if the operation results in a mulliple compleiion or ocompletion in a new interval, a Form 316(N4 shall be filed once
testing has been compleled Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operalor has
determined that the site is ready Ibr final inspection

77tis sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 3500) to measure production from this toell ural tvill be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. 77:is unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

APR2 62006

14 1 hereby cenify that the foregoing is true and corect
Name (Prmied 7)ped)

Title
Beverly Wplker Engineering Technician

l>aie
April 20, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approvat if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warant or
certify ihat the applicant holds legal or equilable title lo those nghts in the subicci lease Ollice
which would entitle the apphcant to conduct operations Ihereon

Title 18 U S.C Section 1001 AND Title 43 USC Section 1212 make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as 10 any matter within ils urisdiction

(Insmienons on page



Form 3160- s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
^P"2°°¾ DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31.2007

5 I ease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If indian. Allollee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3166-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

I TypeofWell NA
on well Gas Weil Other 8 Well Name and No

2 NameofDperator Eed€f3 43-3Ü-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b Phone No. (include area code) 43-047- 74(†4

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 \ 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and PooLot Exploratory Area

4 I.ocalion of Well (Frnwage. Nec. T. R. Al. or Nurrey I)escriptron) Pariette Bench
I I Countv of Parish. Slate

1980' FSI & 659' FEl, NE SE of Section 30-T9S-R19E
.

Uintah County, Utah
12. CilliCK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICI RiiPORT. OR OTIlliR DATA

TYPE OF StiBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Nolice of Inlent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-olf

Allering Casing Fraclure Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequeni Report Casmg Repair New Construction Recompleie Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

I inal Abandonment Notice Converi to Injection Plug back Waler Disposal

13 Desenhe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertineni details, including estimated stalling date of any proposed twirk and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all peninent markers and zones
Altach the liond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with Bl.M/IllA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followmg completion of the involved opemtions If the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompleiton ma new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testmg has been completed Einal Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all ru¡uirements, including reclamation, have bem completed, and the operator has
determmed that the site is ready for final inspection

This well was staried on production on / I 7 (H

APR2 62006

14 I hereby cenify that lhe foiegoing is Irne and correct
Name /Prmted liped)

Title
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Signature Date
April 20, 2006

THISŠPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Condinons of approvat if any are anached Approval of this notice does not warrani or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title lo those rights in the subjeci lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 USC Seclion 1001 AND Title 43 USC Section 1212, make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfillly to make anv depanment or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its urisdiction.

//nstructrons on page

Form 3160- s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
^P"2°°¾ DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31.2007

5 I ease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If indian. Allollee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3166-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

I TypeofWell NA
on well Gas Weil Other 8 Well Name and No

2 NameofDperator Eed€f3 43-3Ü-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b Phone No. (include area code) 43-047- 74(†4

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 \ 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and PooLot Exploratory Area

4 I.ocalion of Well (Frnwage. Nec. T. R. Al. or Nurrey I)escriptron) Pariette Bench
I I Countv of Parish. Slate

1980' FSI & 659' FEl, NE SE of Section 30-T9S-R19E
.

Uintah County, Utah
12. CilliCK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICI RiiPORT. OR OTIlliR DATA

TYPE OF StiBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Nolice of Inlent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-olf

Allering Casing Fraclure Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequeni Report Casmg Repair New Construction Recompleie Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

I inal Abandonment Notice Converi to Injection Plug back Waler Disposal

13 Desenhe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertineni details, including estimated stalling date of any proposed twirk and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all peninent markers and zones
Altach the liond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with Bl.M/IllA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followmg completion of the involved opemtions If the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompleiton ma new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testmg has been completed Einal Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all ru¡uirements, including reclamation, have bem completed, and the operator has
determmed that the site is ready for final inspection

This well was staried on production on / I 7 (H

APR2 62006

14 I hereby cenify that lhe foiegoing is Irne and correct
Name /Prmted liped)

Title
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Signature Date
April 20, 2006

THISŠPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Condinons of approvat if any are anached Approval of this notice does not warrani or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title lo those rights in the subjeci lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 USC Seclion 1001 AND Title 43 USC Section 1212, make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfillly to make anv depanment or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its urisdiction.

//nstructrons on page

Form 3160- s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
^P"2°°¾ DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31.2007

5 I ease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If indian. Allollee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3166-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

I TypeofWell NA
on well Gas Weil Other 8 Well Name and No

2 NameofDperator Eed€f3 43-3Ü-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b Phone No. (include area code) 43-047- 74(†4

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 \ 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and PooLot Exploratory Area

4 I.ocalion of Well (Frnwage. Nec. T. R. Al. or Nurrey I)escriptron) Pariette Bench
I I Countv of Parish. Slate

1980' FSI & 659' FEl, NE SE of Section 30-T9S-R19E
.

Uintah County, Utah
12. CilliCK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICI RiiPORT. OR OTIlliR DATA

TYPE OF StiBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Nolice of Inlent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-olf

Allering Casing Fraclure Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequeni Report Casmg Repair New Construction Recompleie Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

I inal Abandonment Notice Converi to Injection Plug back Waler Disposal

13 Desenhe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertineni details, including estimated stalling date of any proposed twirk and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all peninent markers and zones
Altach the liond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with Bl.M/IllA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followmg completion of the involved opemtions If the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompleiton ma new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testmg has been completed Einal Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all ru¡uirements, including reclamation, have bem completed, and the operator has
determmed that the site is ready for final inspection

This well was staried on production on / I 7 (H

APR2 62006

14 I hereby cenify that lhe foiegoing is Irne and correct
Name /Prmted liped)

Title
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Signature Date
April 20, 2006

THISŠPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Condinons of approvat if any are anached Approval of this notice does not warrani or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title lo those rights in the subjeci lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 USC Seclion 1001 AND Title 43 USC Section 1212, make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfillly to make anv depanment or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its urisdiction.

//nstructrons on page



Form 3 160-5
UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) OMB No 1004-0135DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresJuovember30,2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5 I ease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6 If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. p¿4

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side
7 If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1 Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8 Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Federal 43-3o-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No.
3a Address 3b. Phone No (mc/ude area code) 43-047-3544
8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4 I ocalion of Well (Footage. Sec.. T. R . kl

. or Swwev Description) Pa rig([€ ß€nCh
1980'FSL & 659'FEL I I County or Parish, State

NE SE of Section 30-T9S-R19E
Uintah County, Utah

12. CilliCK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATllRif OF NOTICE. RiiPORT. OR OTlH R DATA
TYPI OF SUBMISSION TYPli OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize O Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) Water Shul-OfT
Alter Casing O Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair O New Construction Q Recomplete Other
Change Plans O Phig and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon ( UllbruÉC ÑAffcP

Final Abandonment Nolice Conven to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal
13 Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. includmg estimated slanmg date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereofIf the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurlisce locations and measured and true vertical depths ofall pertinent markets and zonesAttach the liond under which the work will be performed or provide the llond No on file with Ill M/IllA Required subsequent repons shall be filed within 30 daysfollowmg completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval a Form 316(N4 shall be filed oncetesting has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requrtements, including reclamation. have been completed and the operator hasdetermrned that the site isready for linal inspection

This well is scheduled to have the sales meter calibrated on April 28, 2006 at 9:00 a.nl.

APR2 62008
DN OFO G M NG

14. I hereby certify ihat the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Prmied 7ppecÛ Til Ic

Beverlti Walker Engineering Technician
Signature Dale

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE
Approved by Title Date

Condulons of approval ifany are attached Approval of this notice does nor warrant or ()fÍice
certliy thai the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those nghts in the subject lease
which would entitle the apphcant to conduct operalions thercon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001. make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States anyfalse, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
tinorucuan, on reverse)

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
For Record

Form 3 160-5
UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) OMB No 1004-0135DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresJuovember30,2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5 I ease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6 If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. p¿4

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side
7 If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1 Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8 Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Federal 43-3o-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No.
3a Address 3b. Phone No (mc/ude area code) 43-047-3544
8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4 I ocalion of Well (Footage. Sec.. T. R . kl

. or Swwev Description) Pa rig([€ ß€nCh
1980'FSL & 659'FEL I I County or Parish, State

NE SE of Section 30-T9S-R19E
Uintah County, Utah

12. CilliCK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATllRif OF NOTICE. RiiPORT. OR OTlH R DATA
TYPI OF SUBMISSION TYPli OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize O Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) Water Shul-OfT
Alter Casing O Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair O New Construction Q Recomplete Other
Change Plans O Phig and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon ( UllbruÉC ÑAffcP

Final Abandonment Nolice Conven to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal
13 Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. includmg estimated slanmg date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereofIl the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurlisce locations and measured and true vertical depths ofall pertinent markets and zonesAttach the liond under which the work will be performed or provide the llond No on file with Ill M/IllA Required subsequent repons shall be filed within 30 daysfollowmg completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval a Form 316(N4 shall be filed oncetesting has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requrtements, including reclamation. have been completed and the operator hasdetermrned that the site isready for linal inspection

This well is scheduled to have the sales meter calibrated on April 28, 2006 at 9:00 a.nl.

APR2 62008
DN OFO G M NG

14. I hereby certify ihat the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Prmied 7ppecÛ Til Ic

Beverlti Walker Engineering Technician
Signature Dale

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE
Approved by Title Date

Condulons of approval ifany are attached Approval of this notice does nor warrant or ()fÍice
certliy thai the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those nghts in the subject lease
which would entitle the apphcant to conduct operalions thercon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001. make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States anyfalse, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
tinorucuan, on reverse)

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
For Record

Form 3 160-5
UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) OMB No 1004-0135DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresJuovember30,2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5 I ease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6 If Indian. Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. p¿4

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side
7 If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.

1 Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8 Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator Federal 43-3o-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No.
3a Address 3b. Phone No (mc/ude area code) 43-047-3544
8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado 80112 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4 I ocalion of Well (Footage. Sec.. T. R . kl

. or Swwev Description) Pa rig([€ ß€nCh
1980'FSL & 659'FEL I I County or Parish, State

NE SE of Section 30-T9S-R19E
Uintah County, Utah

12. CilliCK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATllRif OF NOTICE. RiiPORT. OR OTlH R DATA
TYPI OF SUBMISSION TYPli OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize O Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) Water Shul-OfT
Alter Casing O Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair O New Construction Q Recomplete Other
Change Plans O Phig and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon ( UllbruÉC ÑAffcP

Final Abandonment Nolice Conven to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal
13 Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. includmg estimated slanmg date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereofIl the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurlisce locations and measured and true vertical depths ofall pertinent markets and zonesAttach the liond under which the work will be performed or provide the llond No on file with Ill M/IllA Required subsequent repons shall be filed within 30 daysfollowmg completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval a Form 316(N4 shall be filed oncetesting has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requrtements, including reclamation. have been completed and the operator hasdetermrned that the site isready for linal inspection

This well is scheduled to have the sales meter calibrated on April 28, 2006 at 9:00 a.nl.

APR2 62008
DN OFO G M NG

14. I hereby certify ihat the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Prmied 7ppecÛ Til Ic

Beverlti Walker Engineering Technician
Signature Dale

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE
Approved by Title Date

Condulons of approval ifany are attached Approval of this notice does nor warrant or ()fÍice
certliy thai the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those nghts in the subject lease
which would entitle the apphcant to conduct operalions thercon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001. make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States anyfalse, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
tinorucuan, on reverse)

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
For Record



Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo, 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246

Do not use ffais form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6. lf Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3100-3 (APD) for sucir proposais.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instmctions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No

I. Type of Well

Oil well Gas well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator See list below
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)

8 lnverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 801 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec , T, R , M .
or Survey Description)

I I. County or Parish, State

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production ( Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Repon Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details,including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If theoperation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Fonn 316(M shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including teclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that effective immediately we will be disposing of produced
water fromwells withine this lease as follows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
State Evaporation Facility NW1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E Uintah County, Utah. Which is owned by
Gasco Production Company. A copy of the approved permit for this facilityis attached. d by t'n

The wells within this lease are: O ,
Gas an

Federal 13-3oB SW SW of Sec 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-04733581 Û
Federal 21-30-9-19 NE NW of Sec 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-04736739

Federal 23-30-9-19 NE SW of See 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah o43-o47-36095 RECEIVEDFederal 43-3o-9-19 NE SE of Sec 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-35343

OCT2 42006
DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoingis true and correct.
Name (Printed 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walk,qf Engineering Tech

Signature Date
October 18, 2006

THISWACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

goved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowin81yand willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsas to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo, 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246

Do not use ffais form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6. lf Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3100-3 (APD) for sucir proposais.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instmctions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No

I. Type of Well

Oil well Gas well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator See list below
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)

8 lnverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 801 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec , T, R , M .
or Survey Description)

I I. County or Parish, State

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production ( Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Repon Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details,including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If theoperation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Fonn 316(M shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including teclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that effective immediately we will be disposing of produced
water fromwells withine this lease as follows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
State Evaporation Facility NW1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E Uintah County, Utah. Which is owned by
Gasco Production Company. A copy of the approved permit for this facilityis attached. d by t'n

The wells within this lease are: O ,
Gas an

Federal 13-3oB SW SW of Sec 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-04733581 Û
Federal 21-30-9-19 NE NW of Sec 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-04736739

Federal 23-30-9-19 NE SW of See 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah o43-o47-36095 RECEIVEDFederal 43-3o-9-19 NE SE of Sec 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-35343

OCT2 42006
DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoingis true and correct.
Name (Printed 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walk,qf Engineering Tech

Signature Date
October 18, 2006

THISWACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

goved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowin81yand willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsas to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page

Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo, 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-37246

Do not use ffais form for proposals to drill or to re-enteran 6. lf Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3100-3 (APD) for sucir proposais.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instmctions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No

I. Type of Well

Oil well Gas well Other 8. Well Name and No.

2. NameofOperator See list below
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)

8 lnverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 801 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec , T, R , M .
or Survey Description)

I I. County or Parish, State

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production ( Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrity

Subsequent Repon Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details,including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate durationthereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionallyor recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If theoperation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Fonn 316(M shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including teclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that effective immediately we will be disposing of produced
water fromwells withine this lease as follows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
State Evaporation Facility NW1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E Uintah County, Utah. Which is owned by
Gasco Production Company. A copy of the approved permit for this facilityis attached. d by t'n

The wells within this lease are: O ,
Gas an

Federal 13-3oB SW SW of Sec 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-04733581 Û
Federal 21-30-9-19 NE NW of Sec 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-04736739

Federal 23-30-9-19 NE SW of See 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah o43-o47-36095 RECEIVEDFederal 43-3o-9-19 NE SE of Sec 30-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-35343

OCT2 42006
DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoingis true and correct.
Name (Printed 7pped)

Title
Beverly Walk,qf Engineering Tech

Signature Date
October 18, 2006

THISWACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

goved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Office
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowin81yand willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatementsor representationsas to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page



RECEIVED: Jul. 02, 2014

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-37246 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047353430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PARIETTE BENCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1980 FSL 0659 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESE Section: 30 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

8 /1 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Temporary shut in

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Gasco intends to temporarily shut in the Federal 43-30-9-19 in order
to drill four additional wells from the existing well pad. Gasco plans on
setting a retrievable bridge plug at 4950', pulling all tubing out of the
well, filling the hole with 2% KCL water, removing the well head, and

capping the well with a metal plate. The Federal 43-30-9-19 will
remain shut in for the duration of drilling and completion on four

additional wells, approximately 90-120 days.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Jessica Berg 303 996-1805

TITLE
 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 7 /2 /2014

July 31, 2014

Sundry Number: 52913 API Well Number: 43047353430000Sundry Number: 52913 API Well Number: 43047353430000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-37246

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047353430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

1980 FSL 0659 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESE Section: 30 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

8/1/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Temporary shut in

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to temporarily shut in the Federal 43-30-9-19 in order Accepted by the
to drill four additional wells from the existing well pad. Gasco plans on utah Division of

setting a retrievable bridge plug at 4950', pulling all tubing out of the oil, Gas and Mining

well, filling the hole with 2% KCL water, removing the well head, and Date:
July 31, 2014

capping the well with a metal plate. The Federal 43-30-9-19 will
remain shut in for the duration of drilling and completion on four sy: \ h/\ È

additional wells, approximately 90-120 days.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/2/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 02,

Sundry Number: 52913 API Well Number: 43047353430000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-37246

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047353430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

1980 FSL 0659 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESE Section: 30 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

8/1/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Temporary shut in

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to temporarily shut in the Federal 43-30-9-19 in order Accepted by the
to drill four additional wells from the existing well pad. Gasco plans on utah Division of

setting a retrievable bridge plug at 4950', pulling all tubing out of the oil, Gas and Mining

well, filling the hole with 2% KCL water, removing the well head, and Date:
July 31, 2014

capping the well with a metal plate. The Federal 43-30-9-19 will
remain shut in for the duration of drilling and completion on four sy: \ h/\ È

additional wells, approximately 90-120 days.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/2/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 02,

Sundry Number: 52913 API Well Number: 43047353430000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-37246

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047353430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

1980 FSL 0659 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESE Section: 30 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

8/1/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: Temporary shut in

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco intends to temporarily shut in the Federal 43-30-9-19 in order Accepted by the
to drill four additional wells from the existing well pad. Gasco plans on utah Division of

setting a retrievable bridge plug at 4950', pulling all tubing out of the oil, Gas and Mining

well, filling the hole with 2% KCL water, removing the well head, and Date:
July 31, 2014

capping the well with a metal plate. The Federal 43-30-9-19 will
remain shut in for the duration of drilling and completion on four sy: \ h/\ È

additional wells, approximately 90-120 days.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jessica Berg 303 996-1805 Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 7/2/2014

RECEIVED: Jul. 02,



RECEIVED: Feb. 10, 2015

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 UTU-37246 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
 43047353430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 7979 East Tufts Avenue, Suite 1150 , Denver, CO, 80237 303 996-1805  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 PARIETTE BENCH 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1980 FSL 0659 FEL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NESE Section: 30 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

1 /27 /2015

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 After being shut in to drill 4 additional wells on this location, Gasco
Production brought this well back on production on 1/27/2015.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Lindsey J. Cooke 303 996-1834

TITLE
 Production Tech

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 2 /10 /2015

February 18, 2015

Sundry Number: 60737 API Well Number: 43047353430000Sundry Number: 60737 API Well Number: 43047353430000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-37246

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047353430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
7979 East Tufts Avenue, Suite 1150 , Denver, CO, 80237 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

1980 FSL 0659 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESE Section: 30 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

1/27/2015
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

After being shut in to drill 4 additional wells on this location, Gasco Accepted by the
Production brought this well back on production on 1/27/2015. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
February 18, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Lindsey J. Cooke 303 996-1834 Production Tech

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/10/2015

RECEIVED: Feb. 10,

Sundry Number: 60737 API Well Number: 43047353430000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING UTU-37246

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY 43047353430000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
7979 East Tufts Avenue, Suite 1150 , Denver, CO, 80237 303 996-1805 Ext PARIETTE BENCH

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: UINTAH

1980 FSL 0659 FEL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NESE Section: 30 Township: 09.0S Range: 19.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

1/27/2015
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

After being shut in to drill 4 additional wells on this location, Gasco Accepted by the
Production brought this well back on production on 1/27/2015. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
February 18, 2015

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Lindsey J. Cooke 303 996-1834 Production Tech

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 2/10/2015

RECEIVED: Feb. 10,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only 

Effective Date· 4/16/2015 
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERA TOR: 
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265 
7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237 
303-996-1805 303-996-1805 

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV 

WELL INFORMATION: 
Well Name API 
See Attached List 

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION: 
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015 
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015 
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143 

REVIEW: 
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: 
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015 
4. OPS/SIITA welles) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1120/2016 
5. VIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A 
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None 
7. Inspections ofPA statelfee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION: 
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 

2. Indian welles) covered by Bond Number: 
3.State/fee welles) covered by Bond Number(s): 

DATA ENTRY: 

1. Welles) update in the OGIS on: 

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 

3. Unites) operator number update in OGIS on: 
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: 
5. StatelFee welles) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION: 

SUR0027842 
N/A 
SUR0027845 
SUR0035619 -FCB 

1122/2016 
1122/2016 
1122/2016 
N/A 
1122/2016 
N/A 

N/A 
6/2/2015 

N/A 

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division 
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1122/2016 
COMMENTS: 

1/22/2016 

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265
7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237
303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUROO27842
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUROO27845

SUROO35619-FCB

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 1/22/2016
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 1/22/2016
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016
COMMENTS:



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

Well Name -
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 

-------
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 
FEDERAL 31-21 G-9-19 
Federal 323-29-9-19 
Federal 421-29-9-19 
Federal 322-29-9-1 9 
Federal 43 1 -29-9-1 9 
Federal 432-29-9-1 9 
Federal 414-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 

.. _--

-----_._- -
federal 321-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 
Federal 212-29-9-19 
State 321-32-9-19 
State 423-32-9-19 
State 421-32-9-19 
State 413-32-9-1 9 
State 323-32-9-1 9 
State 431-32-9-19 ---
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 

-
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-1 0-1 7 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-1 1-16 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 

-----
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 
SQUA W CROSSING U 5 
RBU 5-lID -
FEDERAL 7-25A 

Section 
18 
17 
18 
29 
20 
21 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
36 
36 
36 
30 
29 
23 
26 
19 
17 
21 
32 
20 
17 
19 
32 
4 
32 
29 
16 
16 
29 
8 
16 
20 
20 
4 
22 
24 
2 
11 

------

25 

TWN 'RNG API Number Enti!Y 
090S 190E 4304752496 
090S 190E 4304752522 
090S 190E 4304752538 ' 
090S 190E 4304752544 

. '.' 

090S 190E 4304752545 
090S 190E 4304752546 
090S 190E 4304753026 
090S 190E 4304753027 
090S 190E 4304753029 ; 
090S 190E 4304753030 
090S 190E 4304753031 i 
090S 190E 4304753070 
090S 190E 4304753073 
090S 190E 4304753076 
090S 190E 4304753078 
090S 190E 4304753079 , 
090S 190E 4304753080 
090S 190E 4304753133 1 
090S 190E 4304754479 
090S 190E 4304754480 
090S 190E 4304754481 
090S 190E 4304754482 ! 

090S 190E 4304754483 
090S 190E 4304754529 
090S 180E 4304754541 
090S 180E 4304754542 
090S 180E 4304754543 
090S 190E 4304753012 19650 
100S 170E 4301333098 15941 
090S 190E 4304736915 16556 
090S 180E 4304738573 17201 
090S 190E 4304739777 18344 
O9OS 190E 4304739800 17202 
1I0S 150E 4301332391 13787 
100S 170E 4301332447 14033 
1l0S 150E 4301332475 14417 
100S 170E 4301332560 -14726 
1l0S 160E 4301332611 14439 
100S ,170E 4301332619 15649 
11 OS 170E 4301332674 15537 

' 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 
100S 170E 4301332679 14033 
1I0S 150E 4301332685 16082 
100S 170E 4301332730 15243 
100S 170E 4301332773 15370 
1I0S 170E 4301332778 14802 
1I0S 160E 4301332888 15098 
100S 170E 4301333081 15714 
100S 1 70E '4301333087 i 15807 
11 OS 170E 4301333099 ' 15920 
1I0S 140E 4301333437 16919 
1I0S ,140E 4301333443 16367 
100S 180E 4304730129 16266 
100S ! 180E 4304730409 9005 

I 

090S 180E I4304730624 19030 

Mineral Surface Type Status 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal 'GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 

---
Federal Federal GW APD 
'Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
Federal Federal GW DRL 

--

Federal Federal GW OPS 
Fee Fee GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal ,GW OPS 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P ---
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Eederal GW P 

.. -

Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State 'OW P 
Federal Federal OW P --
Federal Federal OW P 



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU6-2D 
NGC 33-18J 
RBU 13-2D 

2 
18 
2 

-.-------~--~~----~~--

RBU 16-3D 3 
-----

RBU 1O-1lD 11 
RBU 8-10D 10 
RBU 15-3D 3 
RBU 12-12D 12 
RBU2-10D 10 
RBU 3-15D 15 
RBU 3-12D 12 

--

STATE 7-36A 36 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 
STATE4-32B 32 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 
L YTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 

--

FED 11-21-9-19 21 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 

- -

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 

----
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 

-~ ~--

DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 

--
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 

- --_._--

DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 

-
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 

100S 180EI4304731190 7075 State State OW P 
090S 190E:4304731200 16155 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180Ei4304731280 16267 State State OW P 

----

100S 180E 14304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 1180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 

-+-- ---- c----
100S 1180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
100S ~~304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180EI4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 14304731801 110784 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW IP 
090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 14304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734169 14140 'Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734202 113455 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P 
100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170EI4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734607 :13640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E:4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P 

-~ 

090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735405 114928 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW IP 
090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E!4304735623 i 14640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P 
090S 190E4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P 
100S 180E'4304735808 !15592 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 190E 4304735844 114356 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P 
090S 190E 14304736093 i 14976 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P ---f----

090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P 
090S 180E!4304736220 14763 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P +---
090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P 
090S 190E '4304736271 115884 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P 

---
090S 190E !4304736442 .15715 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E ;4304736600 ! 14977 Federal Federal GW P 
090S I 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW ,P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU6i-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State ONV P
14GiC33-18J 18 090S 190E ‡304731200 6155 Federal Federal DNV P
FU3U13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State CA¥ P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
FU3tJ 10-111) 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal ()VV P
FU3t] 8-10L) 10 100S 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal ()?V JP
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU2-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federed Federed Cygr p
IUBU3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federed Federed CA¥ P
FU3U3-12D 12 100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federed Federal OMT P
STATE7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 Sutte Smte GMT P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFLAL23-29#l 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FE]D44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federed (ITV P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FEI342-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GYV P
PETESM'ASH23-12#1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federed Federal GNV P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FEl3 14-18-2 #1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Fedenal Federal GB¥ P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FEI3 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GVV P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFDAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Fedenal Feden11 GMT P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEE)EFLAL41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Feden11 (39V P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P
LikNIB TItUST24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GMT P
FEEIEftAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E =‡304735808 15592 Federal Federal (39V P
FEDERAL21-6-10-19 6 100S 190E 4304735844 14356 Federed Federed GNV P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STitTE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GVV P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEEIEftAL23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 43047369‡42 15715 Federal Federal (svV P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 
-----

FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 
~HEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 -----_ .. _. __ ._--

FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 

--

----------.. -------

----_. __ . __ ._----_._._._._ .... -

FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 
----------

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 

125 090S 180E i4304736727 '15475 Federal Federal 
--

30 090S 190E'4304736739 !15476 Federal Federal 
-------
25 090S 180E'4304736740 15213 Federal Federal 
19 090S 190E 14304736771 

-----

15355 Federal Federal 
-- , -

~L ____ f?90S :180EI4304736772 15338 Federal Federal 
f-----'---+---

30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal 
--

22 090S 190E 14304736913 15187 Fee Fee 
- -- ------- - -- ----f-------

LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E:4304736916 : 17012 Fee Fee --_._----

DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180Ei4304737115 115011 State State 
.... __ .. _._---_.--- -_ .. --------

FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 '090S .190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal 

.--------- -- 1--

UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 14304737132 15087 i State State 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E i4304737338 ! 15365 State State 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E :4304737611 116311 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S i 190E!4304737612 16051 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 119OE[4304737613 16052 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S '190E:4304737621 16253 !Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E I4304737622 16264 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E :4304737630 16557 Federal Federal 
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E

'
4304737631 15961 Federal Federal 

~ 

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 1180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S : 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E !430473767616254 iState State 

----

180E4304737677h5806 State UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S State 
---- c---

UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S ,180E'4304738028 16868 State State 
-- 1-----

FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S ',190E 4304738336 116467 Federal Federal 
1-------

190E 4304738337 116119 IFederal Federal FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S --------------f-----

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E4304738351 16884 Federal Federal 
--- -

180E~4304738352 ~~ WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 16349 Federal Federal _.-----

SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E [4304738353 16210 Federal Federal 
-

FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S : 190E 4304738407 ; 16236 Federal Federal 
--

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E!4304738465 16558 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180EI4304738469 16449 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal 
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S ,190E 4304738673 : 15832 Fee Fee 
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S 180E4304738896 16792 Federal Federal 
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E:4304739170 16309 State State 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S : 190EI4304739171 16308 State State 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 1 190E 4304739172 116310 State State 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E!4304739717 17054 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E,4304739729 17241 Federal Federal -
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 ! 17266 Federal Federal 

. -------. 
4304739773 -: 17013 ,Federal DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E Federal .... -.--_ ..... -

FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E4304740233 17014 Federal Federal 
- - - -

FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E:4304751280 18211 Federal Federal ---------------c------ c---
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190Ei4304751281 18210 Federal Federal 

----f----
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S : 190E 4304752870_1~64? IFederal Federal -------------------r--------- c----

~~~~~~ !;~:~~:~:! ~ 30 090S 190E14304752872 19648 Federal Federal --_ .. __ .. 
30 090S 190E ;4304753011 19649 Federal Federal 

- --1----------
180E 14304753324 '19783 Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S State State 

Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 : 180E 14304753325 36 090S 19783 State State 
--- --

Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S '180E 4304753326 19747 State State 
Desert SI>ring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E '4304753327 119747 State State 

-- _ ... 

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E :4304753328 119783 State State 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S i 170E 4301332677 ! 15144 State State 
RBU 4-11D III 100S 180E :4304730718 16269 Federal Federal 

GW P 
--

GW P 
-~-. 

GW P 
GW P 
GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
----c------
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

--

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

-------

GW ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,P 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW iP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
-----

GW P 
GW P 

----

GW P 
---

OW P 
OW P 
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

- --
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW :S 
OW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-l l-10-18 11 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State_ GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
RBU4-llD ll 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU2-llD 
~---- --
RBU 6-llD 
STATE2-32B c--
STATE 9-36A 
FEDERAL 13-30B 
STATE 13-36A 
FEDERAL 16-26A 

II ._-- -------

II 
32 

1

36 
30 

-----~---

36 
126 

------------------+-----

FEDERAL 31-29 129 
RBU I-IOD :10 ----------------------_.- I 

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 i 18 

100S 180E 4304730826 116270 Federal Federal OW S 
------- ------ 1-------

100S 180E4304731192 16271 .Federal Federal OW S -+---- --
090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 

-090S1180E 4304732225 il1364 
---

State State IGW S 
090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
090S il80E 4304733598 17838 State State IGW S 
090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
090S ! 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
100S 1180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW .S 
090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal iGW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-l lD 11 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S
STATE 2-32B 32 '090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE 9-36A 36 _ _090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significanUy deepen existing wells below current boItom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drlH horizontal laterals. Use APPLlCA TION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for sUCh proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OILWELL 0 GAS WELL IlJ OTHER __________ _ 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Gasco Production Company 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

7979 E. Tufts Ave. 

4. LOCATIONOFWELL 

CITY Denver 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL 

STATE CO zIP80237 

QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWJIISHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S 

I PHONE NUMBER: 

(303) 483-0044 

UTU-76482 
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UMT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18 
9. API NUMBER: 

4304737631 
10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: 

Uteland Butte 

COUNTY: Uintah 

STATE: 
UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

rlI 0 ACIDIZE 0 DEEPEN 0 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(SubmH in Duplicate) 0 ALTER CASING 0 FRACTURE TREAT 0 SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work wil start: 0 CASING REPAIR 0 NEW CONSTRUCTION 0 TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

4/16/2015 0 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE 0 TUBING REPAIR 

0 CHANGE TUBING 0 PLUG AND ABANDON 0 VENT OR FLARE 

0 SUBSEQUENT REPORT 0 CHANGE WELL NAME 0 PLUG BACK 0 WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

0 CHANGE WELL STATUS 0 PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) 0 WATER SHUT-OFF 
Date of work completion: 

0 COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS 0 RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 0 OTHER: 

0 CONVERT WELL TYPE 0 RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator 01:1 this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco 
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/1612015. 

Gasco Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

Badlands Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui ~ 15 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

(512000) 

TITLE 

DATE 

(See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

RECEIVED 
JUN 0 2 2015 

DIV OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

Engineering Tech 

511812015 

APPROVE 
JAN 22 2016 

~.oIL_ GAS & MINING ... 

BY:~Ch.Jt9 rn~cLU'\~ 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-76482

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill newwells,significantlydeepen exislingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TODRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL O GASWELL OTHER Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

7979 E. Tufts Ave CITY
Denver STATE CO ZIP 80237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL COUNTY: Uintah

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FR^CTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

4/16/2015 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUGAND ABANDON O VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME O PLUGBACK O WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) O WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE O OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly show allpertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on thiswell, in additionto thewells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effectivedate of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 1
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

Michael Decker, Exec. Vi President & COO !)EC61VEL
Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui 15 JUN0 2 205
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

DIVOFOiL,GAS&MINING
Michael Decker, Exec. Vic PreWent&COO

NAME (PLEASE PRIN Lindsey Cooke TITLE Engineering Tech

SIGNATURE DATE 5/18/2015

(Thisspacefo Stateuseonly) APPROVED
JAN2 2 2016

(5/2000) (seeinstruolinsonReverseSide) IV.OlL GAS &



Well Name Section TWN RNO API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal OW DRL 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal OW OPS 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 O9OS 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee OW OPS 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S lSOE 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal OW OPS 
OATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 II OS 150E 4301332391 13787 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332447 14033 State State OW P 
OATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 II OS 150E 4301332475 14417 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 lOOS 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 II OS 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332619 15649 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 4 llOS 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332676 15242 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 lOOS l70E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 llOS 150E 4301332685 16082 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 lOOS 170E 4301332730 15243 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 llOS l70E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 llOS 160E 4301332888 15098 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333087 15S07 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 II OS 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 II OS 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 II OS 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 5-IID II lOOS 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 O9OS 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU6-2D 2 lOOS 180E 430473ll9O 7075 State State OW P 
NOC33-18J 18 O9OS 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 13-20 2 lOOS 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P 
RBU 16-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU IO-IID II lOOS 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU8-IOD 10 l00s 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 15-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 12-120 12 lOOS lSOE 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU2-IOD 10 lOOS 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-15D 15 lOOS 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-12D 12 lOOS 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE7-36A 36 O9OS 180E 4304733741 14244 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 lOOS 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734ll1 13441 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 O9OS 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 O9OS 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal OW P 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 lOOS 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE4-32B 32 O9OS 190E 4304734314 14440 State State OW P 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 lOOS 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 lOOS l70E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal OW P 
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 lOOS lSOE 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 O9OS 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal OW P 

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKINRIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 1005 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 0905 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 1908 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED l2-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE 32-08 8 110S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
RBU5-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 6-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State OW P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P
RBU 16-3D 3 1005 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 8-10D 10 1005 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 1005 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 2-l0D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-12D 12 1005 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 0905 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 0908 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal GW P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GW P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 4-32B 32 0908 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FED 14-18-2#1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FED I 1-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 0905 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW



FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee OW P 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 lOOS 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 lOOS 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 41-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304735845 14639 State State OW P 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 O9OS 190E 4304735995 14871 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 23-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736219 14738 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 21-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736220 14763 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 12-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736233 14764 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 43-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736241 14992 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 O9OS 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 33-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304737115 15011 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 O9OS 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737132 15087 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737338 15365 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO FED 21-1-10-18 I l00s 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 I lOOS 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737676 16254 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737677 15806 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304738028 16868 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal OW P 

FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 0908 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 0903 190E 4304735732 144% Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 0908 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 1005 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 0908 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 0905 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 0905 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 0905 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 0905 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 1005 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 0905 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW



LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P 
UTELAND FED 42-1 1-10-18 II 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P 
STATE21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 Slale Stale GW P 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 Slale State GW P 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P 
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P 
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P 
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State Stale GW P 
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 Slate Slale GW P 
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P 
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P 
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 Slale Stale GW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S 
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 Slale Slale OW S 
RBU 4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU2-11D II 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S 
STATE 2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 Slale State GW S 
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S 
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
RBU 1-100 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S 
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW S 

LAMBTRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 1005 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 0905 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 43047397\7 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED I 1-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 I 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert SpringsState 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
DesertSpring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
SQUAW CROSSING US 2 1005 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW S
RBU4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Fedem! Fedeml ONV S
RBU2-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304730826 16270 Fedeml Fedeml CAV S
RBU6-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304731192 16271 Fedem! Fedeml OAV S
STATE2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 0905 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW
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