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EOG Resources, Inc.

P.O. 1910
Vernal, UT 84078

August 15, 2003

Utah Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

RE: APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
NE/NW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E
UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
LEASE NO.: ML-3355
UTAH STATE LANDS

Enclosed please find a copy of the Application for Permit to Drill and associated
attachments for the referenced well.

Please address further communication regarding this matter (including approval) to:
Ed Trotter
P.O. Box 1910
Vernal, UT 84078
Phone: (435)789-4120
Fax: (435)789-1420

Sincerely,

Ed Trott
Agent
EOG Resources, Inc.

Attachments

RECElVED

SEP16 2003
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

CWU 853-32
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 3

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING AMENDEDREPORT

(highlight changes)
5. MINERALLEASE NO: 6. SURFACE:

APPLICATION FOR PERMITTO DRILL ML-3355 state
1A TYPE OF WORK: DRILL REENTER DEEPEN

7. FFINDIAN,ALLUTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:

O OO O 8. UNITorCA AGREEMERYNAME:
B TYPE OFWELL: OIL GAS A OTHER SINGLEZONE MULTIPLEZONE CHAPITAWELLS UNIT

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. CHAPITAWELLS UNIT853-32
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:

P.O. BOX 1815 env VERNAL STATE UT ZiP 84078 (435) 789-0790 NATURALBUTTES
4. LOCATIONOF WELL(FOOTAGES) 11. OTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

MERIDIAN:
ATSURFACE: 1020' FNL, 2071' FWL

- ¡99 , gf2 og NENW 32 9S 23E
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE:

14. DISTANCEIN MILESAND DIRECTIONFROM NEAREST TOWNOR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:

23 MILESSOUTHEAST OF OURAY,UTAH UINTAH UTAH

15. DISTANCETONEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE UNE (FEET) 16, NUMBEROF ACRESIN LEASE: 17. N IMBEROF ACRESASSIGNED TOTHISWELL:

1020 640
18. DISTANCETO NEAREST WELL (DRILUNG,COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH: 20. BOND DESCRIPTION

APPUED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET)
8,782 JP-0921

21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER OF, RT. GR, ETC.): 22. APPROXiMATEDATEWORK WILLSTART: 23. ESTIMATEDDURATION:

5198.8 GRADED GROUND 10/15/2003 45 DAYS

24. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTINGPROGRAM

SIZE OF HOLE CASINGSIZE, GNADE, ANDWEIGHT PER FOOT SETTINGDEPTN CEMENTTYPE,QUANTITY,YIELD,ANDSLURRY WEIGHT

17 1/2" 13 3/8" H-40 48# 250 SEE 8 POINT PLAN

12 1/4" 9 5/8" J-55 36# 2,500 SEE 8 POINT PLAN

7 7/8" 4 1/2" N-80 11.6# 8,782 SEE 8 POINT PLAN

HEUEIVEU
SEP162003

25. ATTACHMENTS DIVOFOll.AAS* MIblinin
VERIFYTHE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHEDINACCORDANCEWITHTHE UTAHOILANDGAS CONSERVATIONGENERAL RULES:

WELLPLATOR MAPPREPAREDBY UCENSED SURVEYOROR ENGINEER COMPLETEDRILLINGPLAN

2 EVIDENCEOF DIVISIONOF WATER RIGHTSAPPROVALFOR USE OF WATER O FORM 5, IF OPERATOR IS PERSON OR COMPANYOTHER THANTHE LEASE OWNER

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Ed rott Agent

SIGNATURE DATE 8/15/2003

(This space for State use only)

Approvedby the ]

APINUMBERASSIGNED: ( 44 g) Utah DMsion of
^"""°" Oil, Gas and M nMg

(11/2001) (See instmotions on Reverse Side)



EOG RESOURCES, INC.
T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M. Well location, CWU #853-32, located os shown in

the NE 1/4 NW 1/4 of Section 32, T9S, R23E,
S,L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah.

SB956'JJ"W - 2638.33' (Meas.) SB956'27"W - 2640.72' (Meas.)
BASlS OF ELEVATION

Brass Cap 1977 55 .
1977 &ass Cap

G4' Mþh, Steet is Corstar of 20
Rod, Pee or stmes, Ni¢r Pae of semes BENCHMARK 58 EAM (1965) LOCATED IN THE NE 1/4 OF

o Stee/Post 10'2Y SECTION 30, T9S, R23E, S.L.8.&M. TAKEN FROM THE RED
WASH SE, QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY 7.5 MINUTE
QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID

CM/ /853-32 ELEVATION IS MARKEDAS BElNG 5132 FEET.
2071' Elev Ungraded Ground = 5200'

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION. 1

1977 Brass Cqa 1977 Bros, cm N
2' High, PRe 0.4' Mgtt, Pie

of Stones of Starres

o o o

SCALE

CERTtFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABDVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS MADE BY ME OR UNDER MY ,

SUPERVISIONAND THAT THESAME ARE TRUE AND CORRECT TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BE . /

1977 &ass Cp
7J· Hy RM REGISTENEÐLAND SU

1977 Bross Cap = 1977 &ass C Stent Post. Pee REGISTRAT104 NO. I 9
0.8' High, PBe of 0.2' H¢, PRe of of Stones STATE OF UTAH
Stoner, Steet Post Stones, Steet Post

S8959'46"W - 264£28' (Meas.) SB956'0J"W - 26J5.J7' (Meas.)
UINTAH ENGINEERINo se LAND SURVEYlNG

85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078
(435) 789-1017

LEGEND. SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:
1" = 1000 07-14-03 07-28-03

=
90° SYMBOL (AUTONOMOUS NAD 27) PARTY REFERENCES

= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATlTUDE =
39°59'49.07" (39.996964) G.O. T.H. D.COX G.L.O. PLAT

A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE=
109°21'07.53" (109.352092)

WEATHER

WARM
Fit.EEOG

RESOURCES,
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
NEINW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION DEPTH (KB)
Green River 1,448'
Wasatch 4,423'
Island 6,843'
KMV Price River 7,022'
KMV Price River Middle 7,463'
KMV Price River Lower 8,193'
Bit Trip Sego 8,603'
Sego 8,663'
KMV Castlegate 8,844'

EST. TD: 8782 Anticipated BHP 3800 PSI

3.PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: Intermediate Hole - 3000 PSIG
BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:
RATING FACTOR

HOLE SIZE INTERVAL LENGTH SIZE WEIGHT GRADE THREAD COLLAPSE BURST TENSILE
17 1/2" 0' - 250'+/- KB 250' +/- 13 3/8" 48.0 # H-40 STC 770 PSI 1730 PSI 322,000#
12 1/4" 250' - 2500'+/-KB 250(N-/- 9 5/8" 36.0 # J-55 STC 2020 PSI 3520 PSI 394,000#
7 7/8" 2500' - TD +/-KB 8782' +/- 4 1/2" 11.6 # N-80 LTC 6350 PSI 7780 PSI 223,000#

The 12 ¼" Intermediate hole will be drilled to a total depth of 200' below the base of the Green River lost
circulation zone and 9 5/8" casing will be set to that depth. Actual setting depth of the 9 5/8" casing may be less
than 2500' in this well.

All casing will be new or inspected.

5. Float Eguipment:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Insert Baffle
Wooden wiper plug
Centralizers: 1 - 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints (4 total).

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'-2500'):
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Cents.: 1-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5thjoint to surface. (15 total)

8 point plan-EOG



O O
EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
NE/NW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
Float Equipment (Continued):
Production Hole Procedure (2500'-TD):
FS, 1 joint of casing, FC, and balance of casing to surface. Run 11.6#, N-80 burst rating or equivalent
marker collars or short casing joints at ± 7,022' (Top of Price River) and ± 4,000' (400' above the
Wasatch) (alter depth if needed to avoid placing across any potentially- productive intervals).
Centralize 5' above shoe on joint #1, top of joint #2, then every 2nd joint to 400' above Island top (50
total). Thread lock FS, top and bottom of FC, and top of 2ndjOint.

6. MUD PROGRAM

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'below GL):
Air - Air Water Mist

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250-2500'):
Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

Production Hole Procedure (2500'-TD):
2700'- 4500' Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

4500'- 6900' Close in mud system. "Mud up" with 6.0 ppb Diammonium Phosphate (DAP). Drill
with DAP water, POLYPLUS for viscosity and hole cleaning, adding KLA-GARD B for
supplemental inhibition. Also sweep hole periodically w/ Durogel / LCM sweeps to
clean the hole and seal loss zones. Add additional LCM as hole dictates. Mud weight
and vis as needed, water loss -- no control. Maximum mud weight will be 8.6-8.8 ppg.

6900'- TD Discontinue KLA-GARD B. Utilize POLYPAC-R for fluid loss control. Maintain B
& DAP. Do not mix caustic or lime. Maintain 7.5-8.5 pH. Weight up system and
add vis as hole conditions require. Run LCM sweep periodically to seal off loss zones or
more often as hole dictates. Water loss: 20 cc's maximum. Expect increasing gas shows
requiring heavier mud weights from top of Island onward. Treat CO2COntamination with
DESCO CF and OSIL (Oxygen scavenger) if mud properties dictate. Maximum mud
weight will be 8.8-9.2 ppg.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:

A. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring a straight run blooie line (Where
possible, a straight run blooie line will be used).

B. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring an automatic ignitor or
continuous pilot light on the blooie line. (Not required on aerated water system).

C. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.

8 point plan-EOG
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
NE/NW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
To reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be 75' in length.

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:
Logs: Schlumberger Platform Express TD - Surface Casing, with Di-pole Sonic from TD to surface in 1

run.

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'Below GL)
Lead: 300 sks (100% excess volume) Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps D29

(cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft3./sk.,4.95 gps water.

Top Out: Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% $1 (CaCl2) in mix water, 15.8 ppg, 1.16 fP./sk., 4.95
gps via 1" tubing set at 25' if needed.

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'-2500')
Lead: 85 sks: (50% excess volume) Class 'G' lead cement (coverage from 1700-1000') with 5% D44

(Salt), 12% D20 (Bentonite), 1% D79% (Extender), 0.25% D112 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2%
D46 (Anti-Foamer) & 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes) mixed at 11.0ppg, 3.91 ft3/sk., 24.5 gps
water.

Tail: 290 sks: (50% excess volume) Class 'G' cement (coverage from 2700-1700') with 10% D53
(Gypsum), 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes) mixed at 14.2 ppg, 1.61 ft3/sk.,
7.9 gps water.

Production Hole Procedure (2500' to TD)
Lead: 1065 sks 35:65 Poz G w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% Dl74 (Extender), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),

0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% D112 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.15% Dl3 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29
(cello flakes), mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.73 cu. ft./sk., 9.06 gps water

Tail: 190 sks: 50:50 Poz G w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.15% Dl3 (Retarder),
0.2% Dl67 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 cu. ft./sk., 5.9
gps water.

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

INTERMEDIATE HOLE (250-2500')
Potential Problems: Lost circulation below 1800' and minor amounts of gas may be present.

PRODUCTION HOLE (2500'-TD)
Potential Problems: Sloughing shales and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch
Formation. CO2CORÍRminSÍÍOn in the mud is possible in the Price River (Mesa Verde).

8 point plan-EOG
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EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
NE/NW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.
Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
NE/NW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

1. & 2. ESTIMATED TOPS & ANTICIPATED OIL, GAS, & WATER ZONES:

FORMATION DEPTH (KB)
Green River 1,448'
Wasatch 4,423'
Island 6,843'
KMV Price River 7,022'
KMV Price River Middle 7,463'
KMV Price River Lower 8,193'
Bit Trip Sego 8,603'
Sego 8,663'
KMV Castlegate 8,844'

EST. TD: 8782 Anticipated BHP 3800 PSI

3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT: BOP Schematic Diagram attached.

4. CASING PROGRAM:
RATING FACTOR

HOLE SIZE INTERVAL LENGTH SIZE WEIGHT GRADE THREAD COLLAPSE BURST TENSILE
17 1/2" O' - 250'+/- KB 250' +/- 13 3/8" 48.0 # H-40 STC 770 PSI 1730 PSI 322,000#
12 1/4" 250' - 2500'+/-KB 2500+/- 9 5/8" 36.0 # J-55 STC 2020 PSI 3520 PSI 394,000#
7 7/8" 2500' - TD +/-KB 8782' +/- 4 1/2" 11.6 # N-80 LTC 6350 PSI 7780 PSI 223,000#

All casing will be new or inspected.

5. Float Equipment:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'Below GL):
Guide Shoe
Insert Baffle
Wooden wiper plug
Centralizers: 1 - 5-10' above shoe, every collar for next 3 joints (4 total).

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'-2500'):
Guide Shoe
Insert Float Collar (PDC drillable)
Cents.: 1-5' above shoe, top of jts. #2 and #3 then every 5thjOiBÍÍO Surface. (15 total)

Production Hole Procedure (2500'-TD):
FS, 1 joint of casing, FC, and balance of casing to surface. Run 11.6#, N-80 burst rating or equivalent
marker collars or short casing joints at ± 7,022' (Top of Price River) and ± 4,000' (400' above the
Wasatch) (alter depth if needed to avoid placing across any potentially- productive intervals).

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
NE/NW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

Float Equipment Production Hole Procedure (2500'-TD) (Continued):
Centralize 5' above shoe on joint #1, top of joint#2, then every 2nd jointto 400' above Island top (50
total). Thread lock FS, top and bottom of FC, and top of 2nd

6. MUD PROGRAM

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'below GL):
Air - Air Water Mist

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250-2500'):
Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

Production Hole Procedure (2500'-TD):
2700'- 4500' Water (circulate through reserve pit) with Gel/LCM sweeps.

4500'- 6900' Close in mud system. "Mud up" with 6.0 oub Diammonium Phosphate (DAP). Drill
with DAP water, POLYPLUS for viscosity and hole cleaning, adding KLA-GARD B for
supplemental inhibition. Also sweep hole periodically w/ Durogel / LCM sweeps to
clean the hole and seal loss zones. Add additional LCM as hole dictates. Mud weight
and vis as needed, water loss - no control.

6900'- TD Discontinue KLA-GARD B. Utilize POLYPAC-R for fluid loss control. Maintain 5.5

& DAP. Do not mix caustic or lime. Maintain 7.5-8.5 pH. Weight up system and
add vis as hole conditions require. Run LCM sweep periodically to seal off loss zones or
more often as hole dictates. Water loss: 20 cc's maximum. Expect increasing gas shows
requiring heavier mud weights from top of Island onward. Treat CO2 contamination with
DESCO CF and OSIL (Oxygen scavenger) if mud properties dictate.

7. VARIANCE REQUESTS:

A. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring a straight run blooie line (Where
possible, a straight run blooie line will be used).

B. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring an automatic ignitor or ·

continuous pilot light on the blooie line. (Not required on aerated water system).

C. EOG Resources, Inc. requests a variance to regulations requiring the blooie line to be 100' in length.
To reduce location excavation, the blooie line will be 75' in length.

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
NE/NW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

8. EVALUATION PROGRAM:
Logs: Schlumberger Platform Express TD - Surface Casing, with Di-pole Sonic from TD to surface in 1

run.

9. CEMENT PROGRAM:

Surface Hole Procedure (0-250'Below GL)
Lead: 300 sks (100% excess volume) Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps D29

(cellophane flakes), mixed at 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft'./sk., 4.95 gps water.

Top Out: Top out with Class 'G' cement with 2% S1 (CaCl2) in mix water, 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft3./sk.,4.95
gps via 1" tubing set at 25' if needed.

Intermediate Hole Procedure (250'-2500')
Lead: 85 sks: (50% excess volume) Class 'G' lead cement (coverage from 1700-1000') with 5% D44

(Salt), 12% D20 (Bentonite), 1% D79% (Extender), 0.25% Dll2 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2%
D46 (Anti-Foamer) & 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes) mixed at 11.0 ppg, 3.91 ft3/sk., 24.5 gps
water.

Tail: 290 sks: (50% excess volume) Class 'G' cement (coverage from 2700-1700') with 10% D53
(Gypsum), 2% $1 (CaCl2) & 0.25 pps D29 (Cellophane flakes) mixed at 14.2 ppg, 1.61 ft3/sk.,
7.9 gps water.

Production Hole Procedure (2500' to TD)
Lead: 110 sks 35:65 Poz G w/ 4% D20 (Bentonite), 2% D174 (Extender), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant),

0.2% D46 (Antifoam), 0.75% Dll2 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.15% Dl3 (Retarder), 0.25 pps D29
(cello flakes), mixed at 13.0 ppg, 1.73 cu. ft./sk., 9.06 gps water

Tail: 190 sks: 50:50 Poz G w/ 2% D20 (Bentonite), 0.1% D46 (Antifoam), 0.15% D13 (Retarder),
0.2% D167 (Fluid Loss Additive), 0.2% D65 (Dispersant), mixed at 14.1 ppg, 1.28 cu. ft./sk., 5.9
gps water.

10. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

INTERMEDIATE HOLE (250-2500')
Potential Problems: Lost circulation below 1800' and minor amounts of gas may be present.

PRODUCTION HOLE (2500'-TD)
Potential Problems: Sloughing shales and key seat development are possible in the Wasatch
Formation. CO2 contamination in the mud is possible in the Price River (Mesa Verde).

8 point plan-EOG



EIGHT POINT PLAN

CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
NEINW, SEC. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

11. STANDARD REQUIRED EQUIPMENT:

A. Choke Manifold
B. Kelly Cock
C. Stabbing Valve
D. Visual Mud Monitoring

12. HAZARDOUS CHEMICALS:

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA title III in an amount equal to or greater than 10,000 pounds
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in association with the drilling of this well.
Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities,
will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

(Attachment: BOP Schematic Diagram)

8 point plan-EOG



3000 PSIG DIAGRAM

ANNULAR PREVENTOR AND BOTH RAMS ARE 3000 PSIG RATED.
CASING FLANGE IS 11" 3000 PSIG RATED. ROTATING HEAD
BOPE 11" 3000 PSIG

TESTING PROCEDURE: FLOW LINE
1. BOPE's will be tested with a professional tester to conform to Onshore Order #2 ( )

with retest every 14 days.
2. Blind & Pipe rams will be tested to rated working pressure, 3000 psig. I i
3. Annular preventor will be tested to 50% of working pressure, 1500 psig.
4. Casing will be tested to 0.22 psi/ft. or 1500 psig. Not to exceed 70% of burst MAR

strength, whichever is greater. PREVENTER
5. All lines subject to well pressure will be pressure-tested to the same pressure as

blind & pipe rams.
6. All BOPE specifications and configurations will meet Onshore Order #2

requirements for 3000 psig BOPE specifications.
PIPE RAMS

CHOKE MANIFOLD
2" MIN ADJUSTABLE CHOKE

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR
OR PIT BLIND RAMS

A 3" MINIMUM RATED O
3000 PSIG

3" MINIMUM 2" KILL LINE

BLEED LINE TO PIT 3" DIAMETER

CASING

2" MINIMUM LANG
SPOOL 11" 3000 PSIG

TO MUD/GAS SEPARATOR ADJUSTABLE CHOKE
OR
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.
CWU #853-32

SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION FROM VERNAL, UTAH ALONG U.S.
HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 14.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF STATE
HIGHWAY 88; EXIT LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 17.0 MILES TO OURAY, UTAH; PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.3 MILES ON THE SEEP RIDGE ROAD TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT
AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 12.3 MILES TO
THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN
RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 1.7
MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE
EAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 1.9 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION
OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; TURN LEFT AND
PROCEED IN AN EASTERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 4.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST; TURN RIGHT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.1 MILES TO THE JUNCTION
OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND
PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY, THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.9 MILES TO THE BEGINNING OF THE BEGINNING OF THE
PROPOSED ACCESS ROAD FOR THE #805-32 TO THE WEST; FOLLOW ROAD
FLAGS IN A WESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.2 MILES TO THE
PROPOSED ACCESS TO THE NORTHWEST; FOLLOW ROAD FLAGS IN A
NORTHWESTERLY, THEN SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.6
MILES TO THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

TOTAL DISTANCE FROM VERNAL, UTAH TO THE PROPOSED WELL LOCATION
IS APPROXIMATELY54.0



O O
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

FOR THE SURFACE USE PROGRAM OF THE
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
Well Name & Number: Chapita Wells Unit 853-32
Lease Number: ML-3355
Location: 1020' FNL & 2071' FWL, NE/NW,

Sec. 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.,
Uintah County, Utah

Surface Ownership: STATE OF UTAH

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction
of location and access roads.

Location Completion - prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Spud Notice: - at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to
spudding the well.

Casing String and
Cementing - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and cementing all casing strings.

BOP and related
Equipment Tests - twenty-four (24) hours prior to running

casing and tests.

First Production
Notice - within five (5) business days after new

Well begins or production resumes after
Well has been off production for more than
ninety (90) days.

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of
Approval for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

CWU 853-32 D
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THIRTEEN POINT SURFACE USE PROGRAM

l. EXISTING ROADS

A. See attached Wellsite Plats showing directional reference stakes on location,
and attached TOPO Map "B" showing access to location from existing roads.

B. The proposed well site is located approximately 23 miles southeast of Ouray,
Utah - See attached TOPO Map "A" .

C. Refer to attached Topographic Map "A" showing labeled access route to
location.

D. Existing roads will be maintained and repaired as necessary. No off lease
Right-of-Way will be required.

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROAD

A. The access road will be approximately 0.6 miles in length. See attached
TOPO Map "B".

B. The access road has a 30 foot ROW w/ 18 foot running surface.
C. Maximum grade on access road will be 8%.
D. No turnouts will be required.
E. Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing

type.
F. No culverts, bridges, or major cuts and fills will be required.
G. The access road will be dirt surface.
H. No gates, cattleguards, or fences will be required or encountered.

New or reconstructed roads will be centerlined - flagged at time of location
staking.
All travel will be confined to existing access road Right-of-Way. Access roads
and surface disturbing activities will conform to standards outlined in the Bureau
of Land Management and Forest Service Publication: Surface Operating
Standards For Oil & Gas Exploration and Development, (1989).

The road shall be upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated traffic flow
and all-weather road requirements. Upgrading shall include ditching, drainage, graveling,
crowning, and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well-constructed safe road.
Prior to upgrading, the road shall be cleared of any snow cover and allowed to dry
completely. Traveling off the 30 foot Right-of-Way will not be allowed.

Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing type.
Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause siltation or accumulation of debris in
the drainage crossings nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Diverting water
off at frequent intervals by means of cutouts shall prevent erosion of drainage ditches by
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run off water. Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions. Should mud
holes develop, they shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.
As operator, EOG Resources, Inc. shall be responsible for all maintenance on
cattleguards, or gates associated with this oil and/or gas operation.

3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A ONE MILE RADIUS OF
PROPOSED WELL LOCATION

A. Abandoned wells - 2*
(*See attached TOPO map "C" for location)

4. LOCATION OF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED FACILITIES

A. ON WELL PAD

1. Production facilities will be set on location if the well is successfully
completed for production. Facilities will consist of well head valves,
separator, dehy, 210 Bbl condensate tank, meter house and attaching
piping.

2. Gas gathering lines - A 3" gathering line will be buried from dehy to
the edge of the location.

B. OFF WELL PAD

1. Proposed location of attendant off pad flowlines shall be flagged prior
to archaeological clearance.

2. A 3" OD steel above ground natural gas pipeline will be laid
approximately 4564' from proposed location to a point in the NW/NW
of Section 33, T9S, R23E, where it will tie into QuestarPipeline Co.'s
existing line. Proposed pipeline crosses State of Utah administered
lands within the Chapita Wells Unit, thus a Right-of -Way grant will
be not be required.

3. Proposed pipeline will be a 3" OD steel, welded line laid on the
surface.

4. Protective measures and devices for livestock and wildlife will be
taken and/or installed where required.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the
facility/battery or the well pad shall be surrounded by a containment dike
of sufficient capacity to contain, at a minimum, the entire contents of the
largest tank within the facility/battery, unless more stringent protective
requirements are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

The production facilities will be placed on the Southwest side of the
location.

CWU 853-32 D
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5. LOCATION & TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

A. Water supply will be from the Ouray Municipal Water Plant at Ouray, Utah,
and/or Target Trucking Inc.'s water source in the SW/SW, Section 35, T9S,
R22E, Uintah County, Utah (State Water Right #49-1501). Produced water
from the Chapita Wells and Stagecoach Units will also be used.

B. Water will be hauled by a licensed trucking company.
C. No water well will be drilled on lease.

6. SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL

A. All construction material for this location and access road will be of native
borrow and soil accumulated during the construction of the location.

B. No mineral materials will be required.

7. METHODS OF HANDLING WASTE DISPOSAL

A. METHODS AND LOCATION
1. Cuttings will be confined in the reserve pit.
2. A portable toilet will be provided for human waste during the drilling

and completion of the well. Disposal will be at the Vernal sewage
disposal plant.

3. Burning will not be allowed. Trash and other waste material will be
contained in a wire mesh cage and disposed of at the Uintah County
landfill.

4. Produced wastewater will be confined to a lined pit or storage tank for
a period not to exceed 90 days after initial production. After the 90
day period, the produced water will be contained in a tank on location
and then disposed of at one of the following three locations: Natural
Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD, Ace Disposal, or EOG Resources, Inc.
drilling operations (Chapita Wells Unit, Natural Buttes Unit &
Stagecoach Unit).

5. All chemicals will be disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Drip
pans and absorbent pads will be used on the drilling rig to avoid
leakage of oil to the pit.

B. Water from drilling fluids and recovered during testing operations will be
disposed of by either evaporating in the reserve pit or be removed and
disposed of at an authorized disposal site. Introduction of well bore
hydrocarbons to the reserve pit will be avoided by flaring them off in the flare
pit at the time of recovery.

The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge,
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8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES
A. No airstrips or camps are planned for this well.

9. WELLSITE LAYOUT
A. Refer to attached well site plat for related topography cuts and fills and

cross sections.
B. Refer to attached well site plat for rig layout and soil material stockpile

location as approved on On-site.
C. Refer to attached well site plat for rig orientation, parking areas, and

access road.

The reserve pit will be located on the East side of the location. The flare
pit will be located downwind of the prevailing wind direction on the
Southeast side of the location, a minimum of 100 feet from the well head
and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.
The stockpiled topsoil will be stored East and West of Corner #6.

Access to the well pad will be from the East.

Corners #2 & #8 will be rounded off to minimize excavation.

FENCING REQUIREMENTS:

All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

A. Thirty-nine inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand of barbed wire
on top of the net wire. (Barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of
reinforcement rod is attached to the top of the entire fence).

B. The net wire shall be no more than 2 inches above the ground. The barbed
wire strand shall be 3 inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence
shall be at least 42 inches.

C. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner as to keep the
fence tight at all times.

D. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

E. All wire shall be stretched by using a stretching device before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on the three sides during drilling operations and on
the fourth side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and
maintained until clean-up.
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10. PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE

A. PRODUCING LOCATION
Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be
cleared of all unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash, and junknot
required for production.
Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be

removed in accordance with CFR 3162.7-1.
If a plastic nylon reinforced liner is used, it shall be torn and perforated before

backfilling of the reserve pit.

11. SURFACE OWNERSHIP
Access road: State of Utah
Location: State of Utah

12. OTHER INFORMATION
A. EOG Resources, Inc. will inform all persons in the area who are associated

with this project that they are subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing
historic or archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or
archaeological materials are uncovered during construction, the operator will
immediately stop work that might further disturb such materials, and contact
the AO. Within five working days the AO will inform the operator as to:

-whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of Historic
Places;

-the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake before
the site can be used.

-a time frame for the AO to complete an expedited review under 36 CFR
800.11 to confirm, through the State Historic Preservation Officer, that the
findings of the AO are correct and that mitigation is appropriate.

If the operator wished, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the
expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with this process, the
AO will assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization
of the exposed materials that may be required. Otherwise, the operator
will be responsible for mitigation costs. The AO will provide technical
and procedural guidelines for the conduct of mitigation. Upon verification
from the AO that required mitigation has been completed, the operator will
then be allowed to resume construction.
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LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION

PERMITTING AGENT DRILLING OPERATIONS
Ed Trotter Donald Presenkowski
P.O. Box 1910 EOG Resources, Inc.
Vernal, UT 84078 P.O. Box 250
Telephone: (435)789-4120 Big Piney, WY 83113
Fax: (435)789-1420 Telephone: (307)276-4865

All lease or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full
compliance is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas
Orders, the approval plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.
EOG Resources, Inc. is fully responsible for the actions of their subcontractors. A
copy of these conditions will be furnished to the field representative to insure
compliance.

Certification

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drillsite and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions that presently
exist; that the statements made in the Plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be
performed by EOG Resources, Inc. and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this Plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved.

Date Agent
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.

CWU #853-32
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHWESTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: WESTERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATIONPHOTos 7 22 03 ruovo
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 = = =

sme g. 435-789-1017 nels@uelsinc.com TAKENBY:GODRAWNBY:J.LG
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.

LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

CWU #853-32
SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.
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EOG RESOURCES, INC.

TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONSFOR
X-Section

scale CWU #853--32
SECTION 32, T9S, R23E, S.L.B.&M.

1" = 50' 1020' FNL 2071° FWL

DATE: 07-28-03
Drawn By· D.COX

65 135'

Finished Grade

I :---

STA J+25

126'
135°

Slop e= 1 1/2: 1

STA 1+50

. 75'
35° 135°

15-

- Il
CUT -' STA 0+18

126'
135°

Preconstruction

--
¯¯- I"

STA 0+00
'

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES
EXCESS MATERIALAFTER

(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,4]O Cu. Yds. 5% COMPACTION = J,090 Cu. Yds.

Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 3,090 Cu. Yds.
Remaining Location = 5,980 Cu. Yds. (1/2 Pit Vol.)

TOTAL CUT = 7,410 CU.YDS. EXCESSUNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds,
(After Rehobilitation)

FILL = 4, 100 CU.YDS.
UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURV EYING
85 So. 200 East * Vernal. UtuA 84078 • (435)
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g WORKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL '

APD RECEIVED: 09/16/2003 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-35203

WELL NAME: CWU 853-32

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC ( N9550 )

CONTACT: ED TROTTER PHONE NUMBER: 435-789-4120

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
NENW 32 090S 230E

SURFACE: 1020 FNL 2071 FWL Tech Review Initials Date

BOTTOM: 1020 FNL 2071 FWL Engineering
UINTAH L

NATURAL BUTTES ( 630 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 3 - State Surface

LEASE NUMBER: ML-3355 Uk'

SURFACE OWNER: 3 - State LATITUDE: 39.99689

PROPOSED FORMATION: CSLGT LONGITUDE: 109.35209

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

/ Plat R649-2-3.

Bond: Fed[] Ind[] Sta[3] Fee[]
Unit CHAPITA WELLS

(No. JP-0921 - )
Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

No. 49-1501 )
rilling Unit

RDCC Review (Y/N) a Û
Board Cause No: | 's(Date· )
Eff Date: D.

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting: g' ,J

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
STATEMENT OF BASIS

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
WELL NAME & NUMBER: CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
API NUMBER: 43-047-35203
LOCATION:_l/4,1/4 NE/NW Sec: 32 TWP: 9S RNG:23E 2071' FWL 1020' FNL

Geologv/Ground Water:

EOG proposes to set 250 feet of surface casing cemented to the surface. The base of the moderately saline
water is estimated at 2,700 feet. A search of Division of Water Rights records shows no water wells within a
10,000 foot radius of the center of section 32. The surface formation at this location is the Uinta Formation.
The Uinta Formation is made up of discontinuous sands interbedded with shales which are not expected to be
prolific aquifers. The proposed easing and cementing program should adequatelv protect any near surface
aquifers.

Reviewer: Brad Hill Date: 10-06-03

Surface:

The predrill investigation of the surface was performed on 10/02/2003. Surface and minerals for this well are owned
by the State of Utah. S.I.T.L.A. and D.W.R. were notified of this investigation on 9/25/03. Floyd Bartlett
represented the D.W.R. S.I.T.L.A.did not have a representative present. Mr. Bartlett had no concems regarding the
construction of this location or the drilling of this well. This site appears to be the best site in the immediatearea for
a location and well. Mr. Bartlett gaveMr. Ed Trotter (EOG) a seed mix recommended for this area to be used when
reserve pit is reclaimed.

Reviewer: David W. Hackford Date: 10/2/03

Conditions of Approval/Application for Permit to Drill:



O O
ON-SITE PREDRILL EVALUATION

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

OPERATOR: EOG RESOURCES INC
WELL NAME & NUMBER: CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
API NUMBER:43-047-35203
LEASE: ML-3355 FIELD/UNIT: NATURAL BUTTES
LOCATION: 1/4,1/4 NE/NW Sec: 32 TWP: 9S RNG: 23E 2171' FWL 1020' FNL
LEGAL WELL SITING: 460 from unit boundary.
GPS COORD (UTM):6400679E 4428513N SURFACE OWNER: STATE OF UTAH.

PARTICIPANTS

DAVID W. HACKFORD (DOGM), ED TROTTER (EOG), FLOYD BARTLETT (DWR).

REGIONAL/LOCAL SETTING & TOPOGRAPHY

SITE IS IN AN AREA OF NUMEROUS SANDSTONE OUTCROPPINGS, ROLLING
HILLS AND SHALLOW DRAWS DRAINING TO THE SOUTHWEST TO THE WHITE RIVER 3.4
MILES AWAY. SITE IS ON A FLAT TOPPED RIDGE BETWEEN TWO OF THESE DRAWS.

SURFACE USE PLAN

CURRENT SURFACE USE: WILDLIFE AND LIVESTOCK GRAZING, HUNTING.

PROPOSED SURFACE DISTURBANCE: LOCATION WILL BE 325' BY 246'. PROPOSED
ACCESS IS 0.6 MILES.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1 MILE RADIUS: SEE ATTACHED MAP FROM
GIS DATABASE.

LOCATION OF PRODUCTION FACILITIES AND PIPELINES: NEW PRODUCTION
FACILITIES WILL BE ON LOCATION AND ADDED AFTER DRILLING WELL. A GAS
PIPELINE WILL FOLLOW ACCESS ROAD.

SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL: ALL CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL WILL BE
BORROWED FROM SITE DURING CONSTRUCTION.

ANCILLARY FACILITIES: NONE WILL BE REQUIRED.

WASTE MANAGEMENT PLAN:

DRILLED CUTTINGS WILL BE SETTLED INTO RESERVE PIT. LIQUIDS FROM PIT WILL
BE ALLOWED TO EVAPORATE. FORMATION WATER WILL BE CONFINED TO STORAGE
TANKS. SEWAGE FACILITIES, STORAGE AND DISPOSAL WILL BE HANDLED BY
COMMERCIAL CONTRACTOR. TRASH WILL BE CONTAINED IN TRASH BASKETS AND
EAULED TO AN APPROVED LAND FILL.

ENVIRONMENTAL PARAMETERS

AFFECTED FLOODPLAINS AND/OR WETLANDS: NONE

FLORA/FAUNA: SAGEBRUSH, SHADSCALE, PRICKLEY PEAR, GREASEWOOD, INDIAN
RICE GRASS: PRONGHORN, COYOTES, SONGBIRDS, RAPTORS, RODENTS, RABBITS.

SOIL TYPE AND CHARACTERISTICS: LIGHT BROWN SAND WITH SOME



EROSION/SEDIMENTA N/STABILITY: VERY LI LE NATURAL EROSION.
SEDIMENTATION AND STABILITY ARE NOT A PROBLEM AND LOCATION CONSTRUCTION
SHOULDN'T CAUSE AN INCREASE IN STABILITY OR EROSION PROBLEMS.

PALEONTOLOGICAL POTENTIAL: NONE OBSERVED.

RESERVE PIT

CHARACTERISTICS: 147' BY 75' AND 12' DEEP.

LINER REQUIREMENTS (Site Ranking Form attached): A LINER WILL NOT BE
REQUIRED FOR THE RESERVE PIT.

SURFACE RESTORATION/RECLAMATION PLAN: AS PER S.I.T.L.A.

SURFACE AGREEMENT: AS PER STATE OF UTAH

CULTURAL RESOURCES/ARCHAEOLOGY: SITE HAS BEEN INSPECTED BY JIM TRUESDALE.

OTHER OBSERVATIONS / COMMENTS

THIS PREDRILL INVESTIGATION WAS CONDUCTED ON A WARM, SUNNY DAY WITH NO
SNOW COVER.

ATTACHMENTS

PHOTOS OF THIS SITE WERE TAKEN AND PLACED ON FILE.

DAVID W. HACKFORD 10/2/03 11:OO AM
DOGM REPRESENTATIVE



E uation Ranking Criteria and Ranking re
For Reserve and Onsite Pit Liner Requirements

Site-Specific Factors Ranking Site Ranking

Distance to Groundwater (feet)
>200 0
100 to 200 5
75 to 100 10
25 to 75 15
<25 or recharge area 20 __5

Distance to Surf. Water (feet)
>1000 0
300 to 1000 2
200 to 300 10
100 to 200 15
< 100 20 ___0

Distance to Nearest Municipal
Well (feet)

>5280 0
1320 to 5280 5
500 to 1320 10
<500 20 0

Distance to Other Wells (feet)
>1320 0
300 to 1320 10
<300 20 0

Native Soil Type
Low permeability 0
Mod. permeability 10
High permeability 20 _0

Fluid Type
Air/mist 0
Fresh Water 5
TDS >5000 and <10000 10
TDS >10000 or Oil Base Mud Fluid 15

containing significant levels of
hazardous constituents 20 5

Drill Cuttings
Normal Rock 0
Salt or detrimental 10 0

Annual Precipitation (inches)
<10 0
10 to 20 5
>20 10 0

Affected Populations
<10 0
10 to 30 6
30 to 50 8
>50 10 0

Presence of Nearby Utility
Conduits

Not Present 0
Unknown 10
Present 15 0

Final Score 10 (Level III Sensitivity)

SensitivityIovel I = 20 or more; total containment is required.
Sensitivity Level II = 15-19:lining is discretionarv,
SensitivityLevel III = below 15; no specific lining is required
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Points of Diversion Page 1 of 2

UTAH DIVISION OF WATER RIGHTS
WATER RIGHT POINT OF DIVERSION PLOT CREATED MON, OCT 6, 2003, 12:57 PM

PLOT SHOWS LOCATION OF O POINTS OF DIVERSION

PLOT OF AN AREA WITH A RADIUS OF 10000 FEET FROM A POINT
FEET, FEET OF THE CT CORNER,

SECTION 32 TOWNSHIP 9S RANGE 23E SL BASE AND MERIDIAN

PLOT SCALE IS APPROXIMATELY 1 INCH = 4000 FEET
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Well name: 10-03 EOG CWU 853-32
Operator: EOG
String type: Surface Project ID:

43-047-35203
Location: Uintah Co.

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.400 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 68 °F

Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft

Minimum section length: 220 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: Surface

Burst
Nx anticipated surface

pressure: 13 psi
Internal gradient: 0.442 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 123 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 2,500 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 8.600 ppg
Neutral point: 219 ft Next setting BHP: 1,117 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 250 ft
injection pressure 250 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 250 - 13.375 / 48.00 ~ H-40 - ST&C - 250 250 12.59 23.5

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 109 740 6.783 * 123 1730 14.02 12 322 26.83 J

~

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: October 10,2003
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City,Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correctionfor tension.
Collapse is based on a vedical depth of 250 ft, a mud weight of 8.4 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibility for use of this design willbe that of the
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Well name: 10-03 EOG CWU 853-32
Operator: EOG
String type: Intermediate Project ID:

43-047-35203
Location: lJintah Co.

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 8.600 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 100 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft

Minimum section length: 1,500 ft
Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 1,115 ft

Burst
Max anticipated surface

pressure: 2,200 psi
Internal gradient: 0.120 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 2,500 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B) Re subsequent strings:

Next setting depth: 8,782 ft
Tension is based on air weight. Next mud weight: 9.200 ppg
Neutral point: 2,182 ft Next setting BHP: 4,197 psi

Fracture mud wt: 19.250 ppg
Fracture depth: 2,500 ft
Injection pressure 2,500 psi

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift Internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 2500 - 9.625 36.00 - J-55 - ST&C ' 2500 2500 8.796 178

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 1117 2020 1.809 - 2500 3520 1.41 90 394 4.38 J -

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: October 10,2003
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City,Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 2500 ft, a mud weight of 8.6 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibilityfor use of this design willbe that of the
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Well name: 10-03 EOG CWU 853-32
Operator: EOG
String type: Production Project ID:

43-047-35203
Location: Uintah Co.

Design parameters: Minimum design factors: Environment:
Collapse Collapse: H2S considered? No

Mud weight: 9.200 ppg Design factor 1.125 Surface temperature: 65 °F

Design is based on evacuated pipe. Bottom hole temperature: 188 °F
Temperature gradient: 1.40 °F/100ft
Minimum section length: 220 ft

Burst:
Design factor 1.00 Cement top: 2,591 ft

Burst
Nx anticipated surface

pressure: 365 psi
Internal gradient: 0.436 psilft Tension: Non-directional string.
Calculated BHP 4,197 psi 8 Round STC: 1.80 (J)

8 Round LTC: 1.80 (J)
No backup mud specified. Buttress: 1.60 (J)

Premium: 1.50 (J)
Body yield: 1.50 (B)

Tension is based on air weight.
Neutral point: 7,574 ft

Run Segment Nominal End True Vert Measured Drift internal
Seq Length Size Weight Grade Finish Depth Depth Diameter Capacity

(ft) (in) (Ibs/ft) (ft) (ft) (in) (ft')
1 8782 ' 4.5 - 11.60 N-80 - LT&C 8782 8782 3.875 203.6

Run Collapse Collapse Collapse Burst Burst Burst Tension Tension Tension
Seq Load Strength Design Load Strength Design Load Strength Design

(psi) (psi) Factor (psi) (psi) Factor (Kips) (Kips) Factor
1 4197 6350 1.513 ' 4197 7780 1.85 * 102 223 2.19 J "

Prepared Clinton Dworshak Date: October 10,2003
by: Utah Div. of Oil & Mining Salt Lake City, Utah

ENGINEERING STIPULATIONS: NONE
Collapse strength is based on the Westcott, Dunlop & Kemler method of biaxial correction for tension.
Collapse is based on a vertical depth of 8782 ft, a mud weight of 9.2 ppg The casing is considered to be evacuated for collapse purposes.
Burst strength is not adjusted for tension.

Engineering responsibilityfor use of this design willbe that of the
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

]WREPLYREFERTO:
3160
(UT-922)

September 19, 2003

Memorandum

To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2003 Plan of Development Chapita Wells Unit,
Uintah County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Mason, Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management. The following wells are planned for calendar year
2003 within the Chapita Wells Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

Api Number Wel l Location

(Proposed PZ Mesaverde)

43-047·35201 CWU870-30 Sec. 30 T. 95 R. 23E 0607 FNL 1883 FEL
43-047-35202 CWU 551-30 Sec. 30 T. 95 R. 23E 2071 FNL 2028 FWL43-047-35203 CWU 853-32 Sec. 32 T. 95 R. 23E 1020 FNL 2071 FWL
43-047-35204 CWU 851-32 Sec. 32 T. 95 R. 23E 2144 FSL 1931 FWL
43-047-35205 CWU 852-32 Sec. 32 T. 95 R. 23E 2108 FSL 0697 FEL

Please be advised that these wells are currently outside of the
existing Mesaverde Participating Areas within the Chapita Wells
Unit.

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this
time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc: File - Chapita Wells Unit
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron



Diana Whitney - Re: EbÔResou lease bond Page 1

From: Ed Bonner
To: Whitney, Diana
Date: 4/20/2004 9:29:27 AM
Subject: Re: EOG Resources lease and bond

EOG Resources, Inc, ML 3355 and Bond No. JP 0921 are



From: Ed Bonner
To: Whitney, Diana
Date: 10/15/2004 1:57:07 PM
Subject: Well Clearance

The following wells have been given cultural resource clearance by the Trust Lands Cultural Resources
Group:

EOG Resources, Inc
Chapita Wells Unit 853-32

(One site in proposed access/pipeline corridor. EOG must stay on existing road.)

The Houston Exploration Company
Bonanza 14-16
Bonanza 6-20
Bonanza 12-20
Bonanza 14-20

If you have any questions regarding thismatter please give me a call.

CC: Garrison, LaVonne; Hill,Brad; Hunt,
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OLENE S. WALKER

Governor

GAYLE E McKEACHNIE
Lieutenant Governor

October 18, 2004
State of Utah

Department of
Natural Resources

ROBERT L. MORGAN EOG Resources, Inc.
accativeDirector PO Box 1815

Division of
Vernal, UT 84078

Oil, Gas & Mining

LOWELLR BRAXTON -Re: Chapita Wells Unit 853-32 Well, 1020' FNL, 2071' FWL, NE NW, Sec. 32,
nivisionDirec'"' T. 9 South, R. 23 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et
seq., Utah Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of
Approval, approval to drill the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and
continuous operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the
expiration date. The API identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-35203.

S rely,

J Im R. Baza
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
SITLA
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

f
1594 West North Temple, Suite l2l0, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340•facsimile (801) 359-3940•TTY (801) 538-7458 •wwmogm.utah.gov Where ideas
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Operator: EOG Resources, Inc.
Well Name & Number -Chapita Wells Unit 853-32
API Number: 43-047-35203
Lease: ML-3355

Location: NE NW Sec. 32 T. 9 South R. 23 East

Conditions of Approval
1. General

Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for Permit to Drill.

2. Notification Requirements
The operator is required to notify the Division of Oil, Gas and Mining of the following
actions during drilling of this well:

• 24 hours prior to cementing or testing casing
• 24 hours prior to testing blowout prevention equipment
• 24 hours prior to spudding the well
• within 24 hours of any emergency changes made to the approved drilling program
• prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well

The following are Division of Oil, Gas and Mining contacts and their work telephone
numbers (please leave a voice mail message if the person is not available to take the call):

• Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338
• Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284 (spud)

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Fonn (Fonn 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. Compliance with the State of Utah Antiquities Act forbids disturbance of archcological,
historical, or paleontological remains. Should archeological, historical or paleontological
remains be encountered during your operations, you are required to immediately suspend
all operations and immediately inform the Trust Lands Administration and the Division
of State History of the discovery of such remains.

5. Compliance with the Conditions of Approval/Application for Pennit to Drill outlined in
the Statement of Basis. (Copy



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GASANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:

ML-3355

SUNDRYNOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN.AM.OTTEGORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITorCAAGAMEMENTNAME:
00 not use lhls fann for proposals todrillnewwalls,signilleenlly deepen edalingwellsbelow cunentbotlom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells,or to

drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTODRILLform for suchproposals. -- · ·

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER CHAPITAWELLS UNIT853-32

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 4304735203
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX 1910 VERNAL symy,UT »,84078 (435) 789-4120 NATURALBUTTES
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 1020' FNL,2071' FWL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTROTR, SECTION, TOWN$HIP, AANGE,MERIDIAN:.NENW32 $$ .. 23E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

NOTICEOF WTENT
ACIDW DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submitin Dupilcate) ALTERCASING 0 FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIRWELL

as--.»-•-a.t- CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGETO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING O PLUGANDABANDON VENTOft FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT O CHANGEWELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL
(Submit Original Fonn Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of workcomplellon:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER:Extension request

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSEDOR COMPLETED OPERAflONS.Clearlyshowallpertinentdetailsincluding dates, depths. Volumes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. requests thattheAPD for thesubjectwell be extended for one year.

Approved by the i
Utah D ston of

'

Oil,Gas and Minmg --

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) E T TITLE Agent

SIGNATURE ( ( DATE 10/8/2005

(TMs spece for stateuse only)

RECE1VED

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompanythe Sundry Notice requestingpermit extension)

API:
Well Name: CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
Location: 1020' FNL, 2071' FWL, NENW, Sec. 32, T95, R23E
Company Permit issued tO: EOG RESOURCES, INC.
Date Original Permit issued: 10/18/2004

The undersigned as ownerwithlegal rightsto drillon the property as permitted
above, hereby verifiesthatthe informationas submitted in the previously
approved applicationto drill,remains validand does not require revision.

Following is a checklistof some items related to the application,whichshould be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownershipchanged, ifso, has the surface
agreement been updated? Yes O NoO

Have any wellsbeen drilled in the vicinityof the proposed wellwhichwouldaffect
the spacing or sitingrequirementsfor thislocation7 YesO Nom

Has there been any unitorotheragreements put in place thatcouldaffectthe
permitting or operationof thisproposed well7YesO Nom

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership,or right-
of-way,whichcouldaffectthe proposed location? YesO No121

Has the approved sourceofwater for drillingchanged? YesO NoO

Have there been any physical changes tothe surface location or access route
whichwillrequirea change in plans from whatwas discussed at the onsite
evaluation?YesO NoO

Is bonding stillin place, whichcovers thisproposed well?YesŒNoO

10/8/2005

Signature Date

Title: Agent

Representing: EOG RESOURCES, INC. RECEIVED
OCT13 2M

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: EOG RESOURCES INC

Well Name: CWU 853-32

Api No: 43-047-35203 Lease Type: STATE

Section 32 Township 09S Range 23E County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor ROCKER DRILLING RIG # 1

SPUDDED:
Date 04/13/06

Time 3:00 PM

How DRY

Drilling will Commence:

Reported by DALL COOK

Telephone # (435) 828-3630

Date 04/14/2006 Signed



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML 3355
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to CHAPITA WELLS UNIT
dnil horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER CHAPITA WELL UNIT 853-32

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9,APINUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-35203
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WLDCAT:

P.O. BOX 1815 VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 789-0790 NATURAL BUTTES
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: -2487 FNL 1+79 FEL 40.00747 LAT 109.40124 LON COUNTY: UINTAH

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SENE 26 9S 23E S STATE:
UTAH

91. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SlDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASlNG REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVlOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBlNG PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volurnes, etc.

EOG Resources, Inc. requests authorization for disposal of produced water from the referenced well to any of the following
locations.

1. Natural Buttes Unit 21-20B SWD.
2. Ace Disposal
3. RN industries. Accepted by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Min g

By:

EP TTE Regula00or Assistant

(This space for State use on y)

RECENED

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DKOF0\L,GAS&



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML 3355
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, signifcantlydeepen existingwells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° CHAPITA WEL LS UN ITdrill hodzontal laterals. Use APPLICATlON FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER CHAPITA WELL UNIT 853-32

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APiNUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-35203
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FlELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

P.O. BOX 1815 VERNAL UT 84078 (435) 789-0790 NATURAL BUTTES

4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1020 FNL 2071 FWL 39.99689 LAT 109.35209 LON COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDlAN: NENW 32 9S 23E S STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SlDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion

O COMMlNGLE PRODUCING FORMATlONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: WELL SPUD

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATlON

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc

EOG Resources, Inc. spud a 20" surface hole at the referenced location 4/13/2006 at 3:00 p.m. Dall Cook, representative for
EOG, notified Matt Baker of the Vernal BLM office and Carol Daniels of the Utah Division of Oil Gas and Mining of the spud
4/13/2006 @2:00 p.m.

NAME(PLEASE PRlNTVKaylen R. Gardner TITLE Regulatory Assistant

SIGNAT ('My µ DATE 4/19/2006

(This space for State useonly)

RECEIVED
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

DN.0FOIL,GAS&



Apr-26-200605:45m From-EOGRESOURCES +1435TSOTS33 T-279 P.001/001 F-li7

STATE OF UTAN FORMS

OliiPARTMENTOF NATURALREBOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

ENTITY ACTIONFORM

Operator EOG RESOURCES OperatorAccount Number N 9550

Address: P.O. BOX 1815

VERNAL

etateUT g 84078 Phone Numbec (435)781-9111

Well 1

API Number Well Name Seo Twp itng County

43-047-35203 CHAPITAWELLS UNIT863·32 NENW 32 9S 23E UINTAH

Action Code currentEntity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number EfFootiveDate

99999 4/13/2006 / p (,

Comments:

Well 2

API Number Well Name 04 Soo Twp Rag County

43-047-38896 CHAPITAWELLS UNIT93928 SENE 26 98 22E UINTAH

Action Code Current Entity NewEntity Spud Date Endty Assignment
Number Number EffootiveDate

99999 ,/§3) 4/13/2006 ÖÚ
Comments:

Weil 3

API Number Well Name QQ Soo Twp Rng County

43-047.37942 CHAPITA WELLS UNIT837.11X SWSE 11 98 22E UINTAH

Action Codo Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

99999 14852 2/15/2006

Comments:

ACTION000ES:
A - Estabilsh new entity fornew well (singlewellonly) Øþne 0

B - Add new well to exletingentity (gfoupor unitwell) Nmne

C - Re-assign welltomone existingentity toanotherexistingentity
D - Re-assignwellfrom one existing entityto a new entity
E - Other(Explainin 'comments' section) R tory Assistant 4/19/2006

RECEIVED ""' "'"

APR2 6 2008
D",'OE01, GA3â



WELL CHRONOLOGY
REPORT

Report Generated On: 07-27-2006

Well Name CWU 853-32 Well Type DEVG Division DENVER

Field CHAPITA WELLS DEEP API # 43-047-35203 Well Class ISA

County, State UINTAH, UT Spud Date 05-31-2006 Class Date 07-26-2006

Tax Credit N TVD / MD 8,782/ 8,782 Property # 053372

Water Depth 0 Last CSG 2.375 Shoe TVD / MD 0/ 0

KB / GL Elev 5,219/ 5,199

Location Section 32, T9S, R23E, NENW, 1020FNL & 2071 FWL

Event No 1.0 Description DRILL & COMPLETE

Operator EOG RESOURCES, INC WI % 100.0 NRI % 82.5

AFE No 302476 AFE Total 1,443,900 DHC / CWC 732,600/ 711,300

Rig Contr BASIC Rig Name BASIC#30 Start Date 11-03-2003 Release Date

11-03-2003 Reported By

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Well Total $0

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LOCATION DATA

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 LOCATION DATA

1020' FNL & 2071' FWL (NE/NW)

SECTION 32, T9S, R23E

UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

LAT 39.996964, LONG 109.352092 (NAD 27)

BASICRIG#30

TD: 8782' KMV PRICE RIVER LOWER

DWIGAS

CHAPITA WELLS DEEP PROSPECT

DD&A FIELD: CHAPITA DEEP

FIELD: NATURAL BUTI'ES

LEASE: ML-3355

ELEVATION: 5200.3' NAT GL, 5198.8' PREP GL (DUE TO ROUNDING 5199' IS THE PREP GL), 5219' KB (20')

EOGWI 100%, NRI 82.5%

04-16-2006 Reported By ED TROTTER

DailyCosts: Drilling $47,510 Completion $0 Daily Total $47,510

RECEIVED
JUL3 1 2006

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 053372

Cum Costs: Drilling $47,510 Completion $0 Well Total $47,510

MD 0 TVD 0 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : . PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO BUCKET RIG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 5200' NAT GL, CUT AT STAKE 1.5'.

MI CRAIG'S ROUSTABOUT SERVICE. BUILD ACCESSROAD & LOCATION. LINED RESERVE PIT. WO
BUCKET RIG.

04-17-2006 Reported By COOKIBARNES

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $47,510 Completion $0 Well Total $47,510

MD 40 TVD 40 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO AIR RIG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU ROCKER DRILLING RIG #1. SPUD WELL @ 3:00 PM, 4/13/2006. DRILLED 17.5" HOLE TO 40". RAN 40'

OF 14", CONDUCTOR PIPE. CEMENTED CONDUCTORTO SURFACEWITH READY MIX CEMENT.

DALL COOK NOTIFIED MIKE LEE, BLM & CAROL DANIELS, UDOGM OF WELL SPUD, ON 4/13/2006 @ 2:00
PM.

05-17-2006 Reported By COOKIBARNES

Daily Costs: Drilling $204,653 Completion $0 Daily Total $204,653

Cum Costs: Drilling $252,163 Completion $0 Well Total $252,163

MD 2,135 TVD 2,135 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WORT

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 MIRU CRAIGS AIR RIG #2, DRILLED 12-1/4" HOLE TO 2200' GL. HIT WATER @ 1090', l180', 1630'. LARGE
AMOUNT OF WATER @ 1720'. RAN 49 JTS (2115.00') OF 9-5/8", 36.0#lFT, J-55, ST&C CASING WITH
WEATHERFORD GUIDE SHOE AND FLOAT COLLAR. 8 CENTRALIZERS SPACED MIDDLE OF SHOE JOINT

AND EVERYCOLLAR TILL GONE. LANDED @ 2135' KB. RDMOCRAIG'S AIR RIG.

RU BIG 4 CEMENTING. HELD SAFETY MEETING. PRESSURE TESTED LINES AND CEMENT VALVE TO 1000

PSIG. PUMPED 160 BBLS FRESH WATER & 20 BBLS GELLED WATER FLUSH AHEAD OF CEMENT. MIXED &
PUMPED 266 SX (54.5 BBLS)OF CLASS G CEMENTWl2% CACL2 & ¼ #/SX FLOCELE. MIXED CEMENT TO 15.8

PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CFS. DISPLACED CEMENT W/159.9 BBLS FRESH WATER. BUMPED PLUG W/500# @4:

56 PM, 4/23/2006. CHECKED FLOAT, FLOAT HELD. SHUT-IN CASINGVALVE. HOLE DID NOT FILL. NO
CIRCULATION.

TOP JOB # 1 MIXED & PUMPED 184 SX (37.6 BBLS) OF CLASS G CEMENT Wl4% CaCl2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE.

MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. NO CEMENTTO SURFACE. WOC 3 HOURS

TOP JOB # 2. MIXED & PUMPED 225 SX (46 BBLS) OF CLASS G CEMENT Wl4% CaCl2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE.

MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. WOC 2.25 HOURS.

Page 2
RECEIVED
JUL3 12006

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&



Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 053372

TOP JOB # 3. MIXED & PUMPED 100 SX (20.5 BBL) OF CLASS G CEMENT Wl2% CACL2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE.

MIXED CEMENT TO 15.8 PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. WOC 2 HOURS.

TOP JOB #4. MIXED & PUMPED 125 SX (25.6 BBLS) OF CLASS G CEMENT Wl2% CACL2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE.

MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8PPG W/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. WOC 4 HOURS.

TOP JOB # 5. MIXED & PUMPED 225 SX (46 BBLS)OF CLASS G CEMENT Wl2% CaCl2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE.

MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPGW/YIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. WOC 4 HOURS.

TOP JOB #6. MIXED& PUMPED 125 SX (25.6 BBLS)OF CLASS G CEMENT W/2% CACL2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE.

MIXED CEMENT @ 15.8 PPG WlYIELD OF 1.15 CF/SX. NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. WOC 2 HOURS.

TOP JOB #7. MIXED& PUMPED 100 SX (20.5 BBL) OF CLASS G CEMENTW/2% CACL2 & ¼#/SX FLOCELE.

MIXED CEMENTTO 15.8 PPG WlYIELDOF 1.15 CF/SX. NO CEMENT TO SURFACE. RELEASE BIG4

CEMENTERS. RDMO BIG 4.

TOP JOB # 8. ON 5/3/2006ORDERED 4YARDS READY MIX FROMROCKY MOUNTAINDRILLING TO TOP OFF

CEMENT. HOLE TOOK 2.5 YARDSREADY MIX TO FILL. HOLE STOOD FULL.

PREPARED LOCATION FOR ROTARYRIG. WORT. WILL DROP FROM REPORT UNTIL FURTHER ACTIVITY.

MIRU SLICKLINE UNIT & SURVEY TOOL. RAN IN HOLE & TAGGED @ 1996' GL. PICK UP TO 1985' G.L &

TOOK SURVEY, 1 DEGREE.

JERRY BARNESNOTIFIED RICHARD POWELL W/ UDOGMOF THE SURFACE CASING& CEMENT JOB @ 5:00

PM, 4-22-2006.

05-26-2006 Reported By JOHN FOREMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $8,086 Completion $0 Daily Total $8,086

Cum Costs: Drilling $260,249 Completion $0 Well Total $260,249

MD 2,135 TVD 2,135 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: MOVE RIG

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 MOVECAMPS,RIG DOWNTRUCKSDUE ON LOCATION5/26/06 @ 06:00 HRS.

NO ACCIDENTS

DSLTA 266

05-27-2006 Reported By JOHN FOREMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $19,844 Completion $0 Daily Total $19,844

Cum Costs: Drilling $280,093 Completion $0 WellTotal $280,093

MD 2,135 TVD 2,135 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Actívíty at Report Time: RIGGINGUP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 MOVEIN AND SET BASIC RIG # 30

18:00 06:00 12.0 RIG UP BASIC #30, DERRICK AT 1/2 MAST.
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Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 053372

NO ACCIDENTS.

DSLTA 267.

05-28-2006 Reported By JOHN FOREMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $8,923 Completion $0 Daily Total $8,923

Cum Costs: Drilling $289,016 Completion $0 Well Total $289,016

MD 2,135 TVD 2,135 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIG REPAIR

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 RIGGING UP BASIC RIG # 30 FOUND DRILL LINE SEVERLY DAMAGED. SLIP AND CUT 1,000' DRILL LINE,
CANNOT SCOPE DERRICK DUE TO HIGH WIND.

18:00 06:00 12.0 WAIT ON NEW SET OF BLOCKS.

NO ACCIDENTS.

DSLTA 268.

05-29-2006 Reported By JOHN FOREMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $10,032 Completion $0 Daily Total $10,032

Cum Costs: Drilling $299,048 Completion $0 Well Total $299,048

MD 2,135 TVD 2,135 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIG REPAIR

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 WAIT ON NEW TRAVLING BLOCK.

NO ACCIDENTS.

DSLTA 268

05-30-2006 Reported By JOHN FOREMAN

DailyCosts: Drilling $8,514 Completion $0 Daily Total $8,514

Cum Costs: Drilling $306,%3 Completion $0 WeH Total $306,963

MD 2,135 TVD 2,135 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: RIG REPAIR

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 20:00 14.0 WAIT ON TRAVELINGBLOCK, ARRIVED @ 20:00, 5/30/06.

NO ACCIDENTS.

DSLTA 269

20:00 06:00 10.0 WAIT ON CRANE, DUE ON LOCATION 07:00, 5/30/06.

05-31-2006 Reported By FOREMAN/DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $9,149 Completion $0 Daily Total $9,149

Cum Costs: Drilling $316,112 Completion $0 Well Total $316,112
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Well Name:CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 053372

MD 2,135 TVD 2,135 Progress 0 Days 0 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TESTING BOP

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 12:00 6.0 WAIT ON CRANE TO CHANGE OUT TRAVELING BLOCK.

12:00 13:30 1.5 CHANGE OUT AND STRING UP NEW BLOCKS.

13:30 22:00 8.5 SCOPE OUT DERRICKAND COMPLETE RIG UP.

22:00 04:00 6.0 NIPPLE UP BOP AND CHOKE MANIFOLD. RIG ON DAYWORK AT 10:00 PM, 5/30/06.

04:00 06:00 2.0 SAFETY MEETING ON PRESSURE TESTING.RIG UP BC QUICKTEST. TEST UPPER AND LOWER KELLY

VALVES, FLOOR VALVE AND IBOPTO 250-5000 PSI. BEGINTO TEST BOPS. INCOMPLETEAT REPORT TIME.

JOHN FOREMAN NOTIFIED THE UTAH DNR OF MOVE IN RIG ON 5/25/06AT0800 HRS ANDOF PRODUCTION

INTERVAL SPUD ON 5/30/06 AT 0730 HRS.

JOHN FOREMAN NGTIFIED THE VERNAL BLM (MICHAEL LEE) OF MOVE IN RIG AND PENDING BOP TEST

ON 5/26/06 AT 1520 HRS.

RICK DITTO NOTIFIED RAY ARNOLD WITH VERNAL BLM OF SCHEDULED BOP TEST ON 5/30/06 AT 2000

HRS. LEFT VOICE MAIL MESSAGE. CALL WAS NOT RETURNED.

06-01-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $41,256 Completion $0 Daily Total $41,256

Cum Costs: Drilling $357,368 Completion $0 Well Total $357,368

MD 2,724 TVD 2,724 Progress 589 Days 1 MW 8.4 Visc 26.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 08:00 2.0 TEST PIPE RAMS, BLIND RAMS, ALL BOP VALVES,AND CHOKE MANIFOLD TO 250/5000 PSI. TEST

ANNULAR TO 250/2500PSI. ALL TESTS HELD FOR 10 MINUTES.

08:00 08:30 0.5 TEST 9 5/8" CASING TO 1500 PSI FOR 30 MINUTES.

08:30 10:30 2.0 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING. STRAP AND CALIPER BHA.

10:30 14:00 3.5 MAKEUP 7.875 HC504ZX PDC AND PICK UP BHA.

14:00 18:00 4.0 LOAD PIPE RACKSWITH DRILL PIPE AND TALLY. FINISH HOOK UP LINES DOWN STREAM OF CHOKE

MANIFOLD AND GAS BUSTER. TORQUE UPPER KELLY CONNECTION AND PUMP THRU BHA.

18:00 20:30 2.5 PICK UP DRILL PIPE. TAG CEMENT AT 2025'.

20:30 21:00 0.5 INSTALL ROTATINGHEAD ELEMENT. CIRC THRUAND FLUSH GAS BUSTER.

21:00 22:00 1.0 DRILL CEMENT AND SHOE TRACK.

22:00 22:30 0.5 DRILL FROM 2135' TO 2155'. CIRCULATE BTMS UP.

22:30 23:00 0.5 PERFORM CIRCULATING FIT TO 12.8 PPGE (500 PSI).

23:00 03:30 4.5 DRILL FROM 2155' TO 2534'. AVG 84'lHR. PUMPIMG408 GPM WITH 15/17K WOB, ROTATING 60 RPM WITH 65

RPM MUTOR.

03:30 04:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY 2464'. 1.75 DEGREES.

04:00 06:00 2.0 DRILLFROM2534' TO 2724'.

06:00 18.0 SPUD AT 2200 HRS, 5/31/2006

06-02-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $38,625 Completion $1,365 Daily Total $39,990

Cum Costs: Drilling $395,993 Completion $1,365 Well Total $397,358
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Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLSDEEP Property: 053372

MD 4,244 TVD 4,244 Progress 1,520 Days 2 MW 8.7 Visc 33.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: REPAIR RIG.

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 DRILL FROM 2724' TO 3070'. AVG 115'lHR. PUMPING 408 GPM WITH 17-20K WOB. ROTATINGAT 60 RPM
WITH 65 RPM MOTOR.

09:00 09:30 0.5 WIRELINE SUEVEY AT 3000', 2°.

09:30 10:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE. FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAMS.

10:00 18:00 8.0 DRILL FROM 3070' TO 4017'. SAME DRILLINGPERAMETERS.

18:00 18:30 0.5 CIRCULATE. SAFETY MEETING.

18:30 19:00 0.5 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 3945'. 4.5°.

19:00 21:00 2.0 DRILL FROM 4017' TO 4244'. AVG l l4'/HR. PUMPING408 GPM. 18-20K WOB. ROTATING60 RPM, MOTOR 65
RPM.

21:00 06:00 9.0 BROKE DOWN! NOISE IN UPPER ROTARY CHAIN GEAR BOX. PULLED INSPECTION COVER. APPEARS TO BE
FAILED BEARING IN LOWER CHAIN SPROCKET. ROTATE SLOWLY AND RECIPROCATE DRILL PIPE. MIKE
HANCOCK CALLED CROWN FOR AVALABILY OF REPLACEMENT PARTS,AS OF REPORT TIME WE HAVE
RECEIVED NO ANSWER BACK FROM CROWN ON TIMING.

SAFETY TOPICS: USING THE BEST TOOL YOU HAVE TO WORK WITH, YOUR BRAIN. BEING ALERT AND
KNOWINGWHAT IS GOING ON AROUND YOU.

BOP DRILL DAYS: 33 SECS.

06-03-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $11,113 Completion ($1,365) Daily Total $9,748

Cum Costs: Drilling $407,106 Completion $0 Well Total $407,106

MD 4,244 TVD 4,244 Progress 0 Days 3 MW 9.1 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DOWN FOR RIG REPAIRS

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 BROKE DOWN. WAIT ON PARTSAND MECHANIC TO REPAIR UPPER ROTARY CHAIN DRIVE ASSEMBLY.
PULLED UP INTO 9 5/8" SHOE WHILE WAITINGON REPAIR PARTS.STILL WAITINGAT REPORT TIME!

SAFETY MEETING: 100% TIE OFF WHEN WORKING 6' ABOVE GUJSA ON TRIPPING PIPE/GOOD
HOUSEKEEPING

VISUAL INSPECTION OF WIREROPE AND LIFTING SYSTEM

06-04-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $13,415 Completion ($1,365) Daily Total $12,050

Cum Costs: Drilling $420,521 Completion ($1,365) Well Total $419,156

MD 4,620 TVD 4,620 Progress 380 Days 4 MW 9.2 Visc 34.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 21:30 15.5 BROKE DOWN. MECHANICS ARRIVED ON LOCATION WITH REPAIRED CHAIN SPROCKET SHAFT
ASSEMBLY AT 1400 HRS AND INSTALLED INTO CHAIN BOX. NEW CHAIN TENSIONER WHEEL ARRIVED ON
LOCATION AT 1700 HRS. REPAIRS WERE COMPLETED AT 2130 HRS.

21:30 23:30 2.0 TRIP BACK TO BTM FROM SHOE. CIRC BTMS UP.
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Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLSDEEP Property: 053372

23:30 04:00 4.5 DRILL FROM 4244' TO 4562', AVG71'lHR, PUMPING 400 GPM WITH 1580 PSI PP, WOB 17-20K, ROTARY 60
WITH 65 RPM MOTOR.

04:00 05:00 1.0 WIRELINE SURVEY AT 4492', 2 DEGREES.

05:00 06:00 1.0 DRILL FROM 4562' TO 4620'. SAME DRILLINGPERIMETERSWITH 9.4 PPG MUD WT AND 36 VISCOSITY.

DAYLIGHT DRILLER SHOWED UP FOR WORK EXHIBITINGSUSPICIOUSBEHAVIOR. HE REFUSED BREATH
ANALYZER TEST ANDWASTERMINATED.

SAFETY MEETING: 100% TIE OFF AND WORKINGWITH MECHANICS/JSA ON TRIPPING PIPE/

VISUAL INSPECTIONOF WIREROPE AND HOISTINGEQUIPMENT

06-05-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $24,369 Completion $0 Daily Total $24,369

Cum Costs: Drilling $444,890 Completion ($1,365) Well Total $443,525

MD 5,950 TVD 5,950 Progress 1,330 Days 5 MW 9.3 Visc 35.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 14:30 8.5 DRILL 4620' TO 5162', AVG64'/HR. PUMPING 400 GPM WITH 1650 PSI PUMP PRESSURE, 17-20K WOB,
ROTATING 60 WITH 65 RPM MOTOR, MUD WT 9.3 PPG WITH 36 VISCOSITY.

14:30 15:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE. FUNCTION TESTED PIPE RAMS.

15:00 16:00 1.0 ADJUST BRAKESON DRAW WORKS.

16:00 06:00 14.0 DRILL 5162' TO 5950', AVG 54'lHR, PUMPING400 GPM WITH 1670 PSI PUMP PRESSURE, 17-20K WOB.
ROTATING60 WITH 65 RPM MOTOR. MUD WT 9.6 PPG WITH 37 VISCOSITY.

SAFETY MEETING:TEAMWORKlWORKING WITH NEW DRILLER/MAKING CONNECTIONS

VISUAL INSPECTIONOF WIREROPE AND TRAVELING EQUIPMENT

BOP DRILL DAYS 45 SEC, NIGHTS 40 SEC

06-06-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $25,787 Completion $3,671 Daily Total $29,458

Cum Costs: Drilling $470,678 Completion $2,306 Well Total $472,984

MD 6,279 TVD 6,279 Progress 329 Days 6 MW 9.7 Visc 38.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIPPING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 15:00 9.0 DRILL 5950' TO 6279', AVG 37'lHR. PUMPING400 GPM WITH 1700 PSI PUMP PRESSURE, 17-20K WOB,
ROTATING60 WITH 65 RPM MOTOR, MUD WT 9.7 PPGWITH 38 VISCOSITY.

15:00 19:00 4.0 TROUBLE SHOUT NOISE IN UPPER RGTARY DRIVE CHAINCASE. MECHANICDETERMINED THAT NOISE

WAS COMING FROMFAULTY CHAIN TENSIONINGASSEMBLY. REPAIR PARTSNOT AVAILABLE UNTIL
WEDNESDAY. RAISED MUD WT TO 10 PPGWHILE TROUBLESHOGTINGROTARY DRIVE NOISE.

19:00 23:00 4.0 SLUG DRILL PIPE. DROP SURVEY.TRIP OUT FOR NEW BITAND MUD MOTOR. PULL TO 1952'.

23:00 01:00 2.0 REPAIR BURST HYDRALICLINE.

01:00 04:00 3.0 FINISH TOH. LAYDOWN. ROLLERREAMERS.

04:00 06:00 2.0 MAKE UP BIT #2 (HC506Z) AND PICK UP NEW MUD MOTOR. TIH.

SAFETY MEETING: BOP DRILLS

Page 7 RECEIVED
JUL3 12006

DIVOF014GAS&



Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 053372

VISUAL INSPECTION OF WIREROPE AND HOISTINGEQUIPMENT

06-07-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

Daily Costs: Drilling $34,967 Completion $2,541 Daily Total $37,508

Cum Costs: Drilling $505,645 Completion $4,847 Well Total $510,492

MD 6,935 TVD 6,935 Progress 656 Days 7 MW 10.0 Visc 37.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 09:00 3.0 TRIP IN HOLE TO 9 5/8" SHOE.

09:00 12:30 3.5 REPAIR UPPER ROTARY CHAIN TENSIONER.

12:30 15:00 2.5 TRIP IN HOLE. WASH/REAM40' TO BTM,NO FILL.

15:00 06:00 15.0 DRILL FROM 6279' TO 6935'. HEAVY SLOUGHING SHALE OVER SHAKERSON BTMS UP FROM TRIP.
WEIGHT UP TO 10.3 PPG WITH 38VISCOSITY. PUMPING 380 GPM WITH 1500 PSI PUMP PRESSURE. RUTARY
DRIVE CHAIN HAS STARTED TO SLAP AND MAKE NOISE WITH ANY WEIGHT MORE THAN 10-12K ON BIT.
ROTATINGWITH 40 RPM WITH 60 RPM MOTOR.

SAFETY MEETING: WORKING WITH MECHANIC/WORKING WITH ROGERSDRILL PIPE TONGS

VISUAL INSPECTION OF WIRE ROPE AND HOISTING EQUIPMENT

06-08-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $55,050 Completion $0 Daily Total $55,050

Cum Costs: Drilling $560,696 Completion $4,847 Well Total $565,543

MD 7,939 TVD 7,939 Progress 1,004 Days 8 MW 10.4 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 DRILL FROM 6935' TO 7402', AVG49'lHR, WOB 20-22K. PUMPING400 GPM WITH 1550 PSI, ROTATING 40 RPM
+ 64 RPM MOTOR, MUD WT 10.5 PPG WITH 40 VISCOSITY.

15:30 16:00 0.5 RIG SERVICE.

16:00 18:30 2.5 DRILL FROM 7402' TO 7521'. SAME DRILLINGPARAMITERS.MUD WT 10.7 PPG WITH 40 VISCOSITY.

18:30 21:00 2.5 BLEW OUT THE SWIVEL PACKING.NO REPLACEMENT PACKING ON RIG. PUSHER WENT TO BASIC33 FOR
PACKING. RIGGED UP CIRCULATING HOSE. CIRCULATE AND WORK PIPE. REPAIR SWIVEL.

21:00 06:00 9.0 DRILL FROM 7521' TO 7939', AVG46'lHR, WOB 20-22K. PUMPING 380-400 GPM WITH 1550 PSI PUMP PUMP
PRESSURE, ROTATING 40 WITH 65 RPM MOTOR, MUD WT 10.7 PPG WITH 40 VISCOSITY, NO FLARE.

SAFETY MEETING: WORKING ON MUD PUMPS/THE RELEASE OF PRESSURE/LUIO PROCEDURES

VISUAL INSPECTION OF WIREROPE AND HOISTINGEQUIPMENT

06-09-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $28,185 Completion $0 Daily Total $28,185

Cum Costs: Drilling $588,881 Completion $4,847 Well Total $593,728

MD 8,114 TVD 8,114 Progress 175 Days 9 MW 10.6 Visc 41.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 DRILL FROM 7939' TO 8107'. HAD 45 BBL PIT GAIN AND GAS TO SURFACE.
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Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 053372

10:30 21:00 10.5 OPEN HCV. CLOSE ANNULAR. DIVERTGAS FLOW THRU CHOKE AND GAS BUSTER. CIRC DRILLERS
METHOD WITH 80 SPM 600 PSI DRILL PIPE PRESSUREAND 425 PSI INITIAL CASING PRESSURE WHILE
BRINGING UP MUD WEIGHT TO KILL GAS FLARE. WEIGHT UP TO 12 PPG WITH SACK WEIGHT.

21:00 21:30 0.5 OPEN ANNULAR CHECK FOR FLOW. NONE: REPAIR FLOW LINE DRESSER SLEEVE.

21:30 03:00 5.5 START CIRCULATINGAND BEGAN LOSING RETURNS.LOAD SYSTEM WITH 10 PPB LCM AND BUILD MUD
VOLUME.

03:00 05:30 2.5 WORK PIPE AND PUMPS ESTABLISH CIRCULATION. CIRC 2 BTMS UP TO LEVEL OUT MUD WT AT 12 PPG.

05:30 06:00 0.5 DRILL FROM 8107' TO 8114'.

SAFETY MEETING:MAKINGCONNECTIONS/WORKINGON SLIPPERY FLOORIKILLING A GAS KICK

06-10-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $44,872 Completion $0 Daily Total $44,872

Cum Costs: Drilling $633,753 Completion $4,847 Well Total $638,600

MD 8,550 TVD 8,550 Progress 436 Days 10 MW 12.0 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: DRILLING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 16:00 10.0 DRILL FROM 8114' TO 8314', AVG 20'/HR, WOB 20-25K. PUMPING380 GPM WITH 1900 PSI. ROTARY 40 WITH

60 RPM MOTOR, MUD WEIGHT 12.PPG,40 VISCOSITY, 15' GAS FLARE.

16:00 16:30 0.5 RIG SERVICE.

16:30 06:00 13.5 DRILL FROM 8314' TO 8550', AVG17'lHR, WOB 22-25K. PUMPING 380 GPM WITH 1850 PSI. RUTATING 40 RPM

WITH 60 MOTOR, MUD WT 12.2 PPG WITH 45 VISCOSITY AND 15% LCM. INTERMITENT GAS FLARE.

SAFETY MEETINGS: WORKING IN THE HEAT/WORKING WITH INEXPERIENCED PERSONNEUVISUAL

INSPECTIONOF WIREROPE/HOISTINGEQUIPMENT AND BRAKE LINKAGE

06-11-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $39,527 Completion $0 Daily Total $39,527

Cum Costs: Drilling $673,281 Completion $4,847 Well Total $678,128

MD 8,636 TVD 8,636 Progress 86 Days 11 MW 12.1 Visc 43.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: TRIPPING

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 15:30 9.5 DRILL FROM 8550' TO 8636', MOTOR BEGANTO TORQUE AND STALL.

15:30 19:00 3.5 CIRCULATE.LEVEL OUT MUD WT 12.2 PPG IN AND OUT.

19:00 19:30 0.5 DROP SURVEY. SLUG DRILL PIPE.

19:30 03:30 8.0 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BIT.

03:30 06:00 2.5 MAKE UP BIT #3 (SECURITY FM36552). TRIP IN HOLE.

SAFETY MEETING: USINGTHE DRILL PIPE TONGS/TRIPPING PIPE

FUNCTION TESTED BLIND RAMS

06-12-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

DailyCosts: Drilling $38,336 Completion $0 Daily Total $38,336

Cum Costs: Drilling $711,617 Completion $4,847 Well Total $716,464

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 146 Days 12 MW 12.2 Visc 62.0
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Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 053372

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: LD DRILL PIPE

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 07:30 1.5 TRIP IN HOLE WITH BHA AND 30 STNDS. NO MUD RETURNS LAST 15 STNDS.

07:30 08:30 1.0 KELLY UP, ROTATE AND REGAIN CIRCULATION. CONDITIONMUD IN PITS TO 12 PPG.

08:30 09:30 1.0 TRIP IN HOLE TO 5100'.

09:30 10:30 1.0 CIRC/CONDITION MUD TO 12 PPG. ADD FRESH LCM TO SYSTEM, 10-15' GAS FLARE.

10:30 12:30 2.0 FINISH TRIP IN HOLE.

12:30 14:30 2.0 WASH AND REAM70' TO BTM, 30-35' GAS FLARE.

14:30 21:00 6.5 DRILL 8636' TO 8782' TD. REACHED TD AT 21:00 HRS, 6/11/06.

21:00 23:30 2.5 CIRC SAMPLES. CONDITION MUD. MUD WT 12.2 PPG WITH 44 VISCOSITY WITH 12% LCM. SAFETY

MEETINGWITH FRANK'S WESTATESAND ALL RIG PERSONNEL.

23:30 00:30 1.0 RIG UP FRANKS WESTATESLAYDOWN MACHINE.

00:30 06:00 5.5 LAYDOWN DRILL PIPE. INCOMPLETE AT REPORT TIME.

SAFETY MEETING:TRIPPING/RIGGINGUP THIRD PARTY EQUIPMENT/LAYINGDOWN DRILL PIPE

06-13-2006 Reported By RICK DITTO

Daily Costs: Drilling $53,381 Completion $145,346 Daily Total $198,727

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,999 Completion $150,193 Well Total $915,192

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 0 Days 13 MW 12.3 Visc 45.0

Formation : PBTD : 0.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO COMPLETION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 10:30 4.5 LAY DOWN DRILLPIPE. BREAK KELLY. LAY DOWN BHA.

10:30 11:00 0.5 PULL WEAR BUSHING.SAFETY MEETINGWITH FRANKSWESTATES CASING CREW. PICK UP MACHINE

AND ALL RIG PERSONNEL.

11:00 12:00 1.0 RIG UP CASING RUNNING TOOLS.

12:00 19:00 7.0 RUN 205 JTS (203 FULL JTS + 2 MARKER JTS) OF 4.5", P-110, 11.6#,LTCPRODUCTION CASING.LANDED AT

8782' KB. RAN AS FOLLOWS:FS, 1 JT CASING,FLOAT COLLAR AT 8711', 54 JTS CASING, 20' MARKER JT AT

6403', 55 JTS CASING,MARKERJT AT4008', 93 JTS CASING + 6' PUP AND MANDRELHANGER.TAGBTMAT
8782' AND SPACE OUT HANGER).

19:00 22:00 3.0 CIRC WITH RIG PUMPS. CIRC OUT GAS AND CONDITION MUD FOR CEMENTING. SAFETY MEETING WITH

SCHLUMBERGER AND RIG PERSONNEL.

22:00 00:30 2.5 RU SCHLUMBERGER. TEST LINES TO 4500 PSI. PUMP 20 BBLS CHEMICAL WASH AND 20 BBLS WATER

SPACER. MIXED AND PUMPED 450 SKS 35:65 POZ G + ADDITIVES (YIELD 1.75) AT 13 PPG WITH 9.0 GPS H2O
LEAD AND 1440 SKS 50:50 POZ G + ADDITIVES (YIELD 1.29) AT 14.1 PPG WITH 5.96 GPS H2O. DISPLACED TO

FLOAT COLLAR WITH 2 GAL/1000 LO64 FRESH WATER. AVG MIX AND DISPLACEMENTRATE 6.6 BPM. FULL

RETURNSTHROUGHOUT JOB. FINAL PUMP PRESSURE 2466 PSI AT 2.3 BPM. BUMPED PLUGTO 3322 PSI.

BLED OFF PRESSURE, FLOATS HELD. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

00:30 01:00 0.5 LAND MANDREL HANGER IN DTO WELLHEAD WITH FULL STRING WT. TEST TO 5000 PSI FOR 15 MINUTES.

01:00 04:00 3.0 CLEAN MUD TANKS.

04:00 06:00 2.0 RIG DOWN.

WESTROCK TRUCKING SCHEDULED TO MOVE RIG TO CWU 892-22 ON WEDNESDAY MORNING

CEIVED
Page 10
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Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLSDEEP Property: 053372

06:00 18.0 RELEASE RIG AT 04:00 HRS, 6/13/06.

CASING POINT COST $765,598

06-21-2006 Reported By SEARLE

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $41,832 Daily Total $41,832

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,999 Completion $192,025 Well Total $957,024

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 0 Days 14 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : PBTD : 8737.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: WO FRAC

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 6/16/06 MIRU SCHLUMBERGER. LOG WITH RSTICBL/CCL/VDL/GR FROM PBTD TO 400'. CEMENT TOP
ABOVE 400'. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

06-24-2006 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $1,788 Daily Total $1,788

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,999 Completion $193,813 Well Total $958,812

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 0 Days 15 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8711.0 Perf : PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: PREP FOR FRACON 6/28

Start End Hrs Activity Description

10:00 11:00 1.0 NU 10M FRACTREE. PRESSURE TEST FRACTREE & CASING TO 8500 PSIG. PREP FOR FRAC .

06-29-2006 Reported By MCCURDY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $17,249 Daily Total $17,249

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,999 Completion $211,062 Well Total $976,061

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 0 Days 16 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8711.0 Perf : 6634-8528 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FRAC UPR

Start End Hrs Activity Description
06:00 19:20 13.33 MIRUCUTTERSWIRELINE.PERFORATED LPR FROM8371'-72', 8380'-82', 8390'-91', 8416'-17', 8437'-39',

8458'-60', 8488'-89', 8508'-09', 8522'-24', 8527'-28' @ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING.RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.
FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4945 GAL YF125ST+ PAD,54947 GAL YFl25ST+ &
YF118ST+ WITH 190500#20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP 6615 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 5371 PSIG. ATR 50 BPM.
ISIP 3240 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 8330'. PERFORATED LPR/MPR FROM 8091'-92', 8120'-22', 8150'-51', 8175'-76',
8207'-08', 8216'-18', 8242'-43', 8262'-63', 8282'-83' & 8296'-97' @ 3 SPF & 120° PHASING. RDWL. RU
SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH 165 GAL GYFTRON T-106, 4946 GAL YF125ST+ PAD, 54862
GAL YF125ST+ & YF118ST+ WITH 191700#20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP7031 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 5558
PSIG. ATR 49.8 BPM. ISIP 3470 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 8065'. PERFORATED MPR FROM 7829'-30', 7839'-41', 7856'-58', 7886'-87', 7898'-900',
7921'-22', 7973'-75', 7982'-83' & 8039'-41' @ 2 SPF & 180°PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER.FRAC
DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4937 GAL YFl25ST+ PAD, 66085 GALYFl25ST+ &YFll8ST+
WITH 237600#20/40 SAND @ 1-5 PPG. MTP 8127 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 5772 PSIG.ATR 49.4 BPM. ISIP 4510
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

Page 11
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Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 053372

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 7800'. PERFORATED MPR FROM 7569'-70', 7607'-08', 7626'-27', 7634'-36', 7651'-52',
7661'-62', 7699'-00', 7717'-18', 7730'-31', 7751'-52', 7766'-68' & 777l'-72' @ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL.
RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4949 GALYF123ST+ PAD, 50449
GAL YF123ST+ & YF118ST+ WITH 168100#20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP 8613 PSIG. MTR 50.7 BPM. ATP 5280
PSIG.ATR 49.4 BPM. ISIP 2380 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 7490'. PERFORATED UPR FROM 7252'-53', 7294'-95', 7317'-18', 7355'-56', 7386'-88',
7407'-08', 7421'-22', 7431'-33' & 7442'-44' @ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING.RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC
DOWN CASINGWITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4937 GAL YF123ST+ PAD,41599 GALYFl23ST+ & YF118ST+
WITH 128300#20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP 5278 PSIG. MTR 50.8 BPM. ATP 5278 PSIG.ATR 50.1 BPM. ISIP 2340
PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 7110'. PERFORATED UPR FROM 6841'-42', 6864'-66', 6930'-31', 6955'-57', 6968'-70',
6989'-91', 7033'-34' & 7068'-70' @ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING.RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACDOWN
CASING WITH 165 GAL GYFTRON T-106, 4940 GALYF123ST+ PAD, 54,028 GAL YF123ST+ & YFll8ST+ WITH
191200# 20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP 6652 PSIG. MTR 51.1 BPM. ATP 4607 PSIG. ATR 49.4 BPM. ISIP 2250 PSIG.
RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 6810'. PERFORATED UPR FROM 6634'-35', 6640'-41', 6648'-49', 6677'-79', 6693'-94',
6711'-13', 6729'-31', 6741'-42', 6756'-58' & 6768'-69' @ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL. SDFN.

06-30-2006 Reported By MCCURDY / HOOLEY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $422,054 Daily Total $422,054

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,999 Completion $633,116 Well Total $1,398,116

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 0 Days 17 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8711.0 Perf : 6532-8528 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: CLEAN OUT AFTER FRAC

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 18:00 12.0 SICP 1055 PSIG. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRACDOWN CASING WITH 165 GAL GYPTRON T-106, 4975 GAL
YFl23ST+ PAD, 62393 GALYF123ST+ & YF118ST+ WITH 238200#20/40 SAND @ 1-6 PPG. MTP 4353 PSIG. MTR
50.1 BPM. ATP 4093 PSIG. ATR 4093 BPM. ISIP 2270 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CFP AT 6605'. PERFORATED UPR FROM 6532'-33', 6540'-42', 6550'-52', 6558'-60', 6575'-77' &
6582'-84' @ 2 SPF & 180° PHASING. RDWL. RU SCHLUMBERGER. FRAC DOWN CASINGWITH 165 GAL
GYFTRON T-106, 4954 GAL YF123ST+ PAD, 46958 GAL YF123ST+ &YF118ST+WITH 166880#20/40 SAND @ 1-

6 PPG. MTP 5810 PSIG. MTR 50.8 BPM. ATP 4369 PSIG. ATR 50.5 BPM. ISIP 2300 PSIG. RD SCHLUMBERGER.

RUWL. SET 10K CBP AT 6490'. BLED PRESSURE OFF. RDWL. MIRU BASICSERVICE UNIT. ND FRAC TREE. NU
BOPE. RIH Wl3-7/8" BIT & PUMP OFF BIT SUB TO CBP. RU POWER SWIVEL. SDFN.

07-01-2006 Reported By HOOLEY

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $18,039 Daily Total $18,039

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,999 Completion $651,155 Well Total $1,416,155

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 0 Days 18 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8711.0 Perf : 6532-8528 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW BACK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 SICP OPSIG. CLEANED OUT & DRILLED OUT PLUGS @ 6490', 6605', 6810', 7110', 7490', 7800', 8065' AND
8330'. RIH. CLEANED OUT TO 8678'. LANDED TBG AT 6518' KB. ND BOPE. NU TREE. PUMPED OFF BIT &
SUB. RDMOSU. RECOVERED 550 BLW WHILE DRILLING.
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Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITA WELLS DEEP Property: 053372

FLOWED 16 HRS ON 16/64 CHOKE. FTP 2550 PSIG, CP 2850 PSIG, 30 BFPH. RECOVERED 575 BLW, 10220

BLWTR.

TUBING DETAIL LENGTH

PUMP OFF SUB 1.00'

I JT 2-3/8 4.7# N-80 TBG 32.70'

XN NIPPLE 1.10'

198 JTS 2-3/8 4.7# N-80 TBG 6463.68'

BELOW KB 20.00'

LANDED @ 6518.48' KB

07-02-2006 Reported By HOOLEY

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $2,450 Daily Total $2,450

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,999 Completion $653,605 Well Total $1,418,605

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 0 Days 19 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8711.0 Perf : 6532-8528 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: FLOW BACK

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 24 HRS ON 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 2550 PSIG, CP 3300 PSIG, 28 BFPH. RECOVERED 700 BLW, 9557

BLWTR.

07-03-2006 Reported By HOOLEY

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $1,250 Daily Total $1,250

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,999 Completion $654,855 Well Total $1,419,855

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 0 Days 20 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8711.0 Perf : 6532-8528 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: SI - WO FACILITIES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 6 HRS ON 16/64" CHOKE. FTP 2550 PSIG, CP 3250 PSIG, 21 BFPH. RECOVERED 130 BLW, 9427 BLWTR.

SHUTWELL IN. WO FACILITIES.

FINAL COMPLETIONDATE: 7/2/06

07-26-2006 Reported By COOK

Daily Costs: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,999 Completion $654,855 Well Total $1,419,855

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 0 Days 21 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formation : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8711.0 Perf : 6532-8528 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: INITIAL PRODUCTION

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 INITIAL PRODUCTION. OPENINGPRESSURE: TP 3150 & CP 3300 PSI. TURNED WELL OVER TO QUESTAR

SALESAT 10:30 AM, 7/25/06. FLOWED 1245 MCFD RATE ON 10/64" CHOKE.

07-27-2006 Reported By COOK

DailyCosts: Drilling $0 Completion $0 Daily Total $0

Cum Costs: Drilling $764,999 Completion $654,855 Well Total $1,419,855
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Well Name: CWU 853-32 Field: CHAPITAWELLSDEEP Property: 053372

MD 8,782 TVD 8,782 Progress 0 Days 22 MW 0.0 Visc 0.0

Formatíon : MESAVERDE PBTD : 8711.0 Perf : 6532-8528 PKR Depth : 0.0

Activity at Report Time: ON SALES

Start End Hrs Activity Description

06:00 06:00 24.0 FLOWED 1073 MCFD,45 BC & 88 BW IN 24 HRSON 10/64" CK. FTP 2875 & CP 3300 PSIG.
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML3355
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° CHAPITA WELLS UNITdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform forsuch proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER CHAPITA WELL UNIT 853-32
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-35203
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N Denver ETATE CO 80202 (303) 824-5526 NATURAL BUTTES/MESAVERDE

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1020 FNL 2071 FWL 39.996964 LAT 109.352092 LON COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 32 9S 23E S STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: O CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER:

CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The referenced well was turned to sales on 7/25/06. Please see the attached operations summary report for drilling and
completion operations performed on the subject well.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Mary A. Maestas TITLE Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE 7/27/2006

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
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STATE OF UTAH AMENDED REPORT O FORM 8
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES (highlight changes)

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

ML-3355

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

1a. TYPE OF WELL: OIL GAS DRY O OTHER
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME

WELL WELL Chapita Wells Unit
b. TYPE OF WORK: 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

EL
HORZ. O NEP-

TRY
FSFVR.

OTHER Chapita Wells Unit 853-32

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-047-35203

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT

600 17th St., Suite 1000N erry Denver swa CO w 80229 (303) 824-5526 Natural Buttes/Mesaverde

4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

AT SURFACE: 1020' FNL &2071' FWL 39.996964 LAT 109.352092 LON
MERIDIAN:

NENW 32 9S 23E S
AT TOP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELOW: Same

12. COUNTY 13. STATE
AT TOTAL DEPTH: Same Uintah UTAH

14.4 13E/SPOUDD6ED: 15.6DATE Dá0R6EACHED: 16.7D/ATECO L6ETED:
ABANDONED READYTO PRODUCE

17. ELEVAT NNSDF, RKBLRT, GL):

18. TOTALDEPTH: MD gg 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD g 20. IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY7* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD
PLUG SET:

TVD TVD TVD

22. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER MECHANICAL LOGS RUN (Submit copy of each) 23.

WAS WELL CORED7 NO YES (Submit analysis)
RST/CBUCCUVDUG R WAS DST RUN? NO YES O (Submit report)

DIRECTIONALSURVEY7 NO YES (Submit copy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report all strings set In well)

HOLE SIZE SIZE/GRADE WEIGHT (#lft.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) STAGEDŒMHENTER CNEME
S

KES
VOL

UMRE
BL) CEMENT TOP ** AMOUNT PULLED

12-1/4" 9-5/8" J-55 36.0# O 2,135 1350 sx

7-7/8N 4-1/2• P-110 11.6# O 8,782 1890 sx

25. TUBING RECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2-3/8" 6.518
26. PRODUCING INTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM (TVD) INTERVAL(Top/Bot - MD) SIZE NO. HOLES PERFORATION STATUS

(^) Mesaverde 6,532 8,528 8,371 8,528 2/sof ee•= O so-- O
(B) 8.091 8,297 3/sof oo•= O so-- O
(c) 7.829 8,041 2/sof open Sqwd

(D) 7,569 7,772 2/sof open Sqwd

28. ACID, FRACTURE, TREATMENT, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

8371-8528 60,057 GALS GELLED WATER & 190,500# 20/40 SAND
8091-8297 59,973 GALSGELLED WATER & 191,700# 20/40 SAND
7829-8041 71,187 GALS GELLED WATER &237,600#20/40 SAND
29. ENCLOSED ATTACHMENTS: 30. WELL STATUS:

O ELECTRICAL/MECHANICALLOGS GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT DIRECTIONAL SURVEY

O SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYSIS OTHER:

(5/2000) (CONTINUEDON BACK)
RECE IVED
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31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

7/25/2006 7/28/2006 24 RATES: 53 1,507 75 Flows

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS GAS/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

10/64" 2,900 3,100 RATES: -• Pf0ducing
INTERVALB (As shown in Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

RATES:

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. Pl GRAVITY BTU - GAS GASIOIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

RATES: -+

INTERVALC (As shown in Item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS S/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

RATES:

INTERVALD (As shown in item #26)

DATE FIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:

RATES: -+

CHOKE SIZE: TBG. PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU - GAS S/OIL RATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:

RATES: -+

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold, Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

33. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES (Include Aquifers): 34. FORMATION (Log) MARKERS:

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem tests, including depth interval

tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures and recoveries.

Formation Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name (Measured Depth)

Mesaverde 6,532 8,528 Wasatch 4,416
Chaoita Wells 4.946
Buck Canvon 5.634
North Horn 6.257

Island 6.396
Unoer Price River 6.529
Middle Price River 7,482
Lower Price River 8,181
Sego 8,685

35. ADDITIONALREMARK. (Include plugging procedure)

I

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached Information is complete and correct as determined from all available records.

Mm A. Mæstas ¡ATE Regulator Assistant

This report must be subm within 30 days of
e completing or plugging a new well • reentering a previously plugged and abandoned well

e drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore e significantly deepening an existing well bore below the previous bottom-hole depth

e recompleting to a different producing formation • drilling hydrocarbon exploratory holes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Show the number of completions if production is measured separately from two or more formations.

** ITEM24: Cement Top -Show how reported top(s)of cement were determined (circulated (CIR), calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS))

Send to: Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fax: 801-359-3940
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801



CWU B53-32 - ADDITIONAL REMARKS(CONTINUED):

26. PERFORATION RECORD
7252-7444 2/spf
6841-7070 2/spf
6634-6769 2/spf
6532-6584 2/spf

27. ACID, FRACTURE TREATMENT, CEMENT SOUEEZE, ETC.
7569-7772 55,563 GALS GELLED WATER& 168,100# 20/40 SAND
7252-7444 46,701 GALS GELLED WATER & 128,300# 20/40 SAND
6841-7070 59,133 GALS GELLED WATER & 191,200# 20/40 SAND
6634-6769 67,533 GALS GELLED WATER & 238,200# 20/40 SAND
6532-6584 52,077 GALS GELLED WATER & 166,880# 20/40 SAND

Perforated the Lower Price River from 8371-72', 8380-82', 8390-91', 8416-17', 8437-

39', 8458-60', 8488-89', 8508-09', 8522-24' & 8527-28' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Lower/Middle Price River from 8091-92', 8120-22', 8150-51', 8175-76',
8207-08', 8216-18', 8242-43', 8262-63', 8282-83' & 8296-97' w/ 3 spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 7829-30', 7839-41', 7856-58', 7886-8T, 7898-

7900', 7921-22', 7973-75', 7982-83', 8039-41' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Middle Price River from 7569-70', 7607-08', 7626-2T, 7634-36', 7651-

52', 7661-62', 7699-7700', 7717-18', 7730-31', 7751-52', 7766-68' & 7771-72' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 7252-53', 7294-95', 7317-18', 7355-56', 7386-

88', 7407-08', 7421-22', 7431-33' & 7442-44' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 6841-42', 6864-66', 6930-31', 6955-5T, 6968-

70', 6989-91', 7033-34', & 7068-70' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 6634-35', 6640-41', 6648-49', 6677-79', 6693-

94', 6711-13', 6729-31', 6741-42', 6756-58' & 6768-69' w/ 2 spf.

Perforated the Upper Price River from 6532-33', 6540-42', 6550-52', 6558-60', 6575-77'

& 6582-84' w/ 2



STATE OF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator: EOG Resources, Inc· Operator Account Number: N 9550

Address: 600 17th St., Suite 1000N

city Denver

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (303) 824-5526

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-35203 Chapita Wells Unit853-32 NENW 32 9S 23E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number EffectiveDate

C 13884 /6657 4/13/2006
Comments: . .New entity beginning with initial production.

Well 2
API Number Well Name 00 Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-35537 Chapita Wells Unit896-25 SWSW 25 9S 22E Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number EffectiveDate

C 13918 g~ fg 6/7/2005
Comments: . . . . .New entity beginning with initial production.

Well 3

APINumber WellName QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-36695 ChapitaWells Unit969 30 NWNE 30 9S 23E Uintah
Acdon Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Endty Assignment

Number Number Effocuve Dato

e laela /5(, Sg 5/9/2006 ÂŸ Ola
Comments:

ACTIONCODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) MaryA. Maestas
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) lease Prin
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity (g .

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity sig fi
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) RECEIVED Regulato ssistant 9/28/2006

Title Date

(5/2000) SEP2 82006

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



eog resources
EOG Resources, Inc.
600 Seventeenth St., Ste. 1100 N
Denver, co so2o2

January 23, 2006 pos) 572-sooo
Fax pos) 824-5400

Utah Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

RE: CWU #853-32
TO9S-R23E-Sec.32
Uintah, Utah

Gentlemen:

Enclosed herewith are the following logs and data associated with the subject well:

RST Sigma Log Gamma Ray CCL
Cement Bond Log Gamma Ray CCL

Ifyou have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Very trulyyours,

EOG RESOURCES, INC.

Delores Montoya
Exploration & Operations Senior Secretary
Denver Office

Enc.
Cc: Well File RECEIVED

JAN3 0 2û&

DNOFOIL,m&MINING

energy opportunity



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML-3355

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IFINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTR18ENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to ddll new wells, significantlydeepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° Cha ita Wells Unit

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
OIL WELL GAS WELL / OTHER Chapita Wells Unit 853-32

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

EOG Resources, Inc. 43-047-35203
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

600 17th St., Suite 1000N , Denver sTATE CO ,,,80202 (303) 262-2812 Natural Buttes/Mesaverde

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1,020' FNL &2,071' FWL 39.996964 LAT 109.352092 LON COUNTY: UINTAH

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 32 9S 23E S.L.B.&M. STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDiZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

O NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF

Date of work completion:
O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Pit reclamation

O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

The reserve pit for the referenced location was closed on 9/25/2006 as per the APD procedure.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) Carrie MacDonald TITLE Operations Clerk

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED
FEBi 22007

(See Instructions on Reverse Side) DIV.OFOIL,GAS&MINING



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

CH s Utah State Office INAM ERICA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

EOG Resources, Inc. SEP10 2007
Attn: Debbie Spears
600 Seventeenth Street
Suite 100N
Denver, Colorado 80202

Re: 16 Revision Consolidated Mesaverde Formation PA
"A-B-D-E-F-G-H-I-J-K-L-N-P" Chapita Wells Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

The 1'*Revision to the Consolidated Mesaverde Formation PA "A-B-D-E-F-G-H-I-J-K-L-N-P"Chapita
Wells Unit, CRS No. UTU63013AH, AFS No. 892000905AH, is hereby approvedeffective as of July 1,
2006, pursuant to Section 11 of the Chapita Wells UnitAgreement, Uintah County, Utah.

The 1" Revision to the Consolidated Mesaverde Formation PA "A-B-D-E-F-G-H-l-J-K-L-N-P" results in
an addition of 320.00 acres to the participating area for a totalof 9,194.69 acres and is based upon the
completion of the followingwells as capable of producing unitized substances in paying quantities:

To Isbso Scerra
WELL NO. API NO. LOCATION LEASE NO.

CWU 851-32 43-047-35204 NE¼SW¼, 32-9S-23E STATE

CWU 854-33 43-047-35177 NE¼SE¼, 33-98-23E UTUO336

CWU 853-32 43-047-35203 NE¼NW¾, 32 OS-23E STATE §
CWU 939-26 43-047-36696 SE¼NE¼, 26-98-22E UTUO285A

Copies ofthe approved request are being distributed tothe appropriate federal agencies and one copy is
returned herewith. Please advise all interested parties of the approval of the 16 Revision to the
Consolidated Mesaverde Formation PA "A-B-D-E-F-G-H-I-J-K-L-N-P",Chapita Wells Unit, and the
effective date.

Sincerely,

/s/ Julie Howard

Julie Howard
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals



STATEOF UTAH FORM 6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator: EOG Resources, Inc. Operator Account Number: N 9550

Address: 600 17th St., Suite 1000N

city Denver

state CO zip 80202 Phone Number: (303) 824-5526

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-35204 CWU 851-32 NESW 32 9S 23E Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number Effective Date
C 15009 13650 10/24/2005 7/1/2006

Comments:

Well 2
API Number Well Name OG Sec Twp Rng County
43-047-35177 CWU 854-33 NESE 33 9S 23E Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number Effective Date
CommenCts: 170 13650 1/29/2006 7/1 006

Well 3

API Number Well Name OG Sec Twp Rng County
43 045352Ò3 CWU 853-32 NENW 32 BS 23E Uintah
Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment

Number Number Effective Date
C 15657 13650 4/13/2006 7/1/2006

Comments:

ACTION CODES:
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) Mary A. Maestas
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) N (Please Prin
C - Re-assign well fromone existing entity toanother existing entity
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity signature
E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Regulatory Assistant 12/26/2007

Title Date

(5/2000) RECEIVED
DEC2 6 2007

DIV.0F0lL,GAS&



4 STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

ML 3355
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRlBE NAME

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to CHAP ITA WELLS UN ITdrill horizontal laterais. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form forsuch proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER CHAPITA WELL UNIT 853-32
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

EOG RESOURCES, INC. 43-047-35203
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FlELD AND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:

1060 East Highway 40 Vernal UT 84078 (435) 789-0790 NATURAL BUTTES
4. LOCATlON OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 1020 FNL 2071 FWL 39 99689 LAT109.35209 LON COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 32 9S 23E S STATE:
UTAH

. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAlR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Site Facility Diagram
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE -DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Attached please find a site facility diagram.

NAME(PU¯A Micke zie cke DATE Opera2tion8sClerk

(Tliis space for State use only) RECEIVED
OCTU8 2003

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
DIVOFOIL,GAS&



Bhrer/stlens

eog resources *Site Facility Diagram a.neuen sees ww.,
NN MM NESS UNE

AM= Allocation Meter
AR = Access Road

Well Name:CHAPITA WELLS UNIT 853-32
Site facility diagrams & site PV O SC SC CHT = Chemical Tank

1/4 1/4:NE/NW Sec:32 T:9S R:23E security plans are located at the LV SC O SC
ccScocnodmepnresrsor

County:UINTAH State:UTAH 'ona o cet
d a

1n0a
0

ahst
H WD SC SC O CT = Condensate Tank

Lease: ML-3355 40 and normal business hours are emctpi ePanel

UNIT\PA#: 892000905A-N,P, T °d0
a

t301 pMonfr DATED 9/30/2008 ET = Emergency Tank
FW = Firewall
LACT = LACT Unit
LH = Line Heater
LV = Load Valve
MAN = Manifold
MB = Methanol Bath

D D D O=Open
PL = Production Line
PP = Power Pole

CWU863-32 CWU86342 OWU73¾32 PT = Propane Tank
400 Shl 400 Bby 400Obl PU = Pumping Unit

Tank Tank Ta à PV = Production Valve
PW = Produced Water
RL = Recycle Line

L L L RP = Recycle Pump
V y V RV = Recycle Valve

ROAD SC = Sealed Closed
SGS = Sales Gas Scrubber
SL = Sales Line
SM = Sales Meter
SO = Sealed Open
SP = Separator
SV = Sales Valve
T = Treater
TP = Trace Pump
WD = Water Drain
WDP = Water Disposal Pump
WFP = Water Flood Pump
WH = Wellhead

CWU 731-32 CWU 853-32
----- = Buried Line

cm 853-32 = Unburied Line
WH WH

v 731-32 = Meter Display

= Meter Tube

WU 731-32 = Production Valve

SALES LINE SEP
DEHY

=



RECEIVED: Aug. 28, 2014

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 ML-3355 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 CHAPITA WELLS 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Gas Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 CWU 853-32 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EOG RESOURCES, INC.

9. API NUMBER:
 43047352030000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 NATURAL BUTTES 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1020 FNL 2071 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: NENW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

8 /22 /2014

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER:  Well Connect

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 CWU 853-32 was connected to Davies Road Facility, Sec 33-T9S-R23E
on August 22, 2014. All wells producing at the Davies Road Facility are

within the PA# A-Z, AA-BB UTU63013BF.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Donna J Skinner 303 262-9467

TITLE
 Sr. Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 8 /28 /2014

August 28, 2014

Sundry Number: 54974 API Well Number: 43047352030000Sundry Number: 54974 API Well Number: 43047352030000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING ML-3355

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals. CHAPITAWELLS

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Gas Well CWU 853-32

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EOGRESOURCES,lNC. 43047352030000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
600 17th Street, Suite 1000 N , Denver, CO, 80202 435 781-9111 Ext NATURALBUTTES

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGESATSURFACE: UINTAH

1020 FNL 2071 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: NENW Section: 32 Township: 09.0S Range: 23.0E Meridian: S UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

8/22/2014
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCATWELLDETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: WellConnect

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

CWU 853-32 was connected to Davies Road Facility, Sec 33-T9S-R23E
Accepted by the

on August 22, 2014. All wells producing at the Davies Road Facility are Utah Division of
within the PA# A-Z, AA-BB UTU63013BF. Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
August 28, 2014

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Donna J Skinner 303 262-9467 Sr. Regulatory Assistant

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 8/28/2014

RECEIVED: Aug. 28,
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