- GASCO|
Energy

February 19, 2003

Bureau of Land Management
Vernal Field Office

170 S. 500 E.

Vemal, UT 84078

Re: Federal No. 22-30-10-18
SE/4 NW/4, S30, TI0S-R18E
Uintah County, UT

Gentlemen:

This letter is to inform you that Permitco Inc. is authorized to act as Agent and -0 si gn
documents on behalf of Gasco Energy, Inc., when necessary for filing county, state and
federal permits including Onshore Order No. I, Right of Way applications, etc.. for the
above mentioned well.

[t should be understood that Permiteo is acting as Agant only in those matters stared

above and is not responsible for drilling, complction, production or compliance with
reguiations.

Gasco Energy, Inc.. agrees o accept full responsibility for operations conducted i arcer
to drill. complete and produce the above mentioned well.

Very truly yours, _
%MM

Darrell Finneman, CPL
Land Manager

GASGO nergy, Inc,
“eimvarress Irive Zast, Suita H-243 Tel. |303) 483-009a

email INvastggascoenergy com
Cnglewzed, €D 80112-5625 Sax; {3031 183 3031

Website: www gescoanargy com ITCBAY AL



APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER
24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.
Attached.

2. A Drilling Plan

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the SUPO shall be filed with the Appropriate Forest
Service Office.
See Surface Use Plan Attached.
4,

Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see Item 20).

Bond coverage for this well is provided by GASCO Energy, Inc. under theit BLM Bond No. Bond # 4127759.

5. Operator certification.

Please be advised that GASCO Energy, Inc. is considered to be the operator of the above mentioned well. GASCO

Energy, Inc. agrees to be responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon
the leased lands.

6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the authorized officer.
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ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore
Federal and Indian Qil and Gas L.eases

Alllease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made with applicable
laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Qil and Gas Order No. 1, and the approved plan of operations. The

operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished
the field representative to insure compliance.

1. ESTIMATED TOPS OF IMPORTANT GEOLOGIC MARKERS

Formation Depth Subsea
Uintah Surface 5,452'
Green River 1,422' 4,030'
Wasatch 4,972 -480'
Mesaverde 8,600’ -3,148'
T.D. 12,500' -7,048'

2. ESTIMATED DEPTH OF ANTICIPATED WATER, OIL, GAS OR MINERAL FORMATIONS:

Substance Formation Depth
Gas/Oil Green River 1,422
Gas Wasatch 4,972
Gas Mesaverde 8,600'

All fresh water prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be recorded

by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to determine
commercial potential.
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3. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT

GASCO Energy, Inc's minimum specifications for pressure control equipment are as follows:

Ram Type: 11" Hydraulic double with annular, 5000 psi w.p.

Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack working pressure
if isolated by test plug or to 70 percent of internal yield pressure of casing. Pressure shall be
maintained for at least 10 minutes or until requirements of test are met, whichever is longer. If a test
plug is utilized, no bleed-off pressure is acceptable. For a test not utilizing a test plug, if a decline in
pressure of more than 10 percent in 30 minutes occurs, the test shall be considered to have failed.
Valve on casing head below test plug shall be open during test of BOP stack.

Annular type preventers (if used) shall be tested to 50 percent of rated working pressure. Pressure
shall be maintained at least 10 minutes or untif provisions of test are met, whichever is longer.

As a minimum, the above test shall be performed:

when initially installed;

whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken
following related repairs; and

at 30-day intervals

aoop

Valves shall be tested from working pressure side during BOPE tests with all down stream valves
open.

When testing the kill line valve(s) the check valve shall be held open or the ball removed.
Annular preventers shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip, however, this function need not be performed more
than once a day.

A BOPE pit level drill shall be conducted weekly for each drilling crew.
Pressure tests shall apply to all related well control equipment,

All of the above described tests and/or drills shall be recorded in the drilling log.
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BOP systems shall be consistent with API RP53. Pressure tests will be conducted before drilling out
from under casing strings which have been set and cemented in place. Blowout preventer controls
will be installed prior to drilling the surface casing plug and will remain in use untit the well is completed
or abandoned. Preventers will be inspected and operated at least daily to ensure good mechanical
working order, and this inspection will be recorded on the daily drilfing report. Preventers will be
pressure tested before drilling casing cement plugs.

The District Office should be notified, with sufficient lead time, in order to have the BLM representative
on location during pressure testing.

a.

The size and rating of the BOP stack is shown on the attached diagram. Although a rig has
not been chosen to drill this well, most of the equipment for this depth of hole in the area use
a 11", 5000 psi working pressure blowout preventor.

A choke line and a kill line are to be properly installed. The kil line is not to be used as a
fill-up line.

The accumulator system shall have a pressure capacity to provide for repeated operation of
hydraulic preventers.

Drill string safety valve(s), to fit all tools in the drill string, are to be maintained on the rig floor
while drilling operations are in progress.

4. PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM:

a.

The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved to protect
and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones, lost circulation zones,
abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively valuable deposits of minerals. Any
isolating medium other than cement shall receive approval prior to use. The casing setting
depth shall be calculated to position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which
will contain the maximum pressure to which it will be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all relevant factors,
including; presence/absence of hydrocarbons; fracture gradients; usable water zones;
formation pressures; lost circulation zones; other minerals; or other unusual characteristics.
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All indications of usable water shall be reported.

b. Casing design shall assume formation pressure gradients of 0.4 to 0.50 psi per foot for
exploratory wells (lacking better data).

c. Casing design shall assume fracture gradients from 0.70 to 1.00 psi per foot for exploratory
wells (lacking better data)

d. Casing collars shall have a minimum clearance of 0.422 inches of all sides in the hole/casing
annulus, with recognition that variances can be granted for justified exceptions.

e. All waiting on cement times shall be adequate to achieve a minimum of 500 psi compressive
strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

f. All casing except the conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and tested used casing
that meets or exceeds API standards for new casing.

g. The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary cement job
or by remedial cementing.

h. Allindications of usable water shall be reported to the authorized officer prior to running the
next string of casing or before plugging orders are requested, whichever occurs first.

. Three centralizers will be run on the bottom three joints of surface casing with a minimum of
one centralizer per joint starting with the shoe joint.

J- Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement fluid. A bottom
plug or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush fluid, inner string cement
method, etc. shall be utilized to help isolate the cement from contamination by the mud fluid
being displaced ahead of the cement slurry.

k. All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressure tested to 0,22 psi per foot of casing
string length or 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed 70 percent of the minimum

internal yield. If pressure declines more than 10 percent in 30 minutes, corrective action shall
be taken.

g

\ :
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L On all exploratory wells, and on that portion of any well approved for a 5M BOPE system or
greater, a pressure integrity test of each casing shoe shall be performed. Formation at the
shoe shall be tested to a minimum of the mud weight equivalent anticipated to control the

formation pressure to the next casing depth or at total depth of the well. This test shall be
performed before drilling more than 20 feet of new hole.

m. The proposed casing program will be as follows:
Purpose Depth Hole Size | 0O.D. Weight | Grade | Type | New/Used
Conductor 0-220' 17-12" | 13-3/8" 48% H-40 ST&C New
Surface 0-3500' 12-1/4* 9-5/8" 40% J-55 LT&C New
Production 0- 12,500° 7-7/8" 4-1/2" 13.5# P-110 | LT&C New
n.

Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.

0. The cement program will be as follows:
Conductor Type and Amount
0-220' 260 sx Class G, 3% CaCl2 with 0.25 #/sk Flocele @ 15.6
ppg, 1.19 cu ft/sk. Cement to be circulated to surface.
Estimated volume (100% over theoretical value).
Surface Type and Amount
0-3500' Lead: 465 sx Hi-Fill @ 12.0 ppg, 2.87 cu fi/sk.
Tail: 380 sx Class G 2% CaCl2 @ 15.8 ppg, 1.16 cu ft/sk.
Cement will be circulated to surface, Estimated volume (35%
over theoretical value).
Production Type and Amount
0-12,500' Lead: 450 sx Hi-Fill @ 11.0 ppg, 3.84 cu f/sk.
Tail: 1790 sx 50/50 POZ @14:35 ppg, 1.26 cu ft/sk.
Estimated volume {gauge hole +15%).
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p. Anticipated cement tops will be reported as to depth; not the expected number of sacks of

cement to be used. The District Office should be notified, with sufficient lead time, in order
to have a BLM representative on location while running all casing strings and cementing.

q. After cementing but before commencing any test, the casing string shall stand cemented until

the cement has reached a compressive strength of at least 500 psi at the shoe. WOC time
shall be recorded in the driller's log.

r. The following reports shall be filed with the District Manager within 30 days after the work is
completed.

1. Progress reports, Form 3160-5 (formerly 9-331) "Sundry Notices and Reports on
Wells", must include complete information concerming:

a. Setting of each string of casing, showing the size, grade, weight of casing
set, hole size, setting depth, amounts and type of cement used, whether
cement circulated or the top of the cement behind the casing, depth of
cementing tools used, casing test method and results, and the date work
was done. Show the spud date on the first reports submitted.

b. Temperature or bond logs must be submitted for each well where the casing
cement was not circulated to the surface.
. Auxiliary equipment to be used is as follows:
1. Kelly cock
2. No bit float is deemed necessary.
3. A sub with a full opening valve.

PERMITC(




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE
GASCO Energy, Inc.
Federal #22-30-10-18 Lease No. UTU-74408
1968' FNL and 2161' FWL
SE NW Sec. 30, T10S - R18E DRILLING PROGRAM
Uintah County, Utah Page 7
5. MUD PROGRAM
a. The proposed circulating mediums to be employed in drilling are as follows:
Interval Mud Type Mud Wt. Visc. FIL Comments
0 - 400' Spud 84-90 | 30-45 N/C Gel & lime as required
400' - top of Wasatch | Water/Gel | 8.4-88 | 27-35 N/C Min. Wt.
Top of Wasatch-TD | KCLMud | 85-11.2 | 35-45 | 10-15¢C's Min. Wt. to control
formation pressure

There will be sufficient mud on location to control a blowout should one occur.
A mud test shall be performed every 24 hours after mudding up to determine, as applicable;
density, viscosity, gel strength, static filtration loss, and Ph.

b. Mud monitoring equipment to be used is as follows:

1. Periodic checks will be made each tour of the mud system. The mud level will be
checked visually.

C. No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and/or Indian lands without
prior BLM approval to ensure adequate protection of fresh water aquifers.

d. No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title Il in an amount equal to or greater than
10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in
association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous substances,
as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used, produced, stored,
transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

e. The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

a [+
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6. EVALUATION PROGRAM

The anticipated type and amount of testing, logging and coring are as follows:

a. No drill stem tests are anticipated, however, if DST's are run, the following requirements will
be adhered to:

Initial opening of drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours unless specific
approval to start during other hours is obtained from the authorized officer. However, DST's
may be allowed to continue at night if the test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate
of flow is stabilized and if adequate lighting is available (i.e. lighting which is adequate for
visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can be released, but tripping shall not

begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained from the authorized officer. Closed
chamber DSTs may be accomplished day or night.

A DST that flows to the surface with evidence of hydrocarbons shall be either reversed out
of the testing string under controlled surface conditions. This would involve provided some
means for reverse circulation.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly installed before
a test starts. -

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to "run" during the test shall have
spark arresters or water cooled exhausts.

b. The logging program will consist of a DLLT/GR from TD to base of surface casing. A
SDU/DSN/GR/CAL will be run from TD to 300" above Green River. A MRIL will be run from
TD to 100" above Wasatch (at operators discretion).

C. No cores are anticipated.

d. Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, “Well Completion and
Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) will be submitted not later than 30 days after
completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with
43 CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well-test data,
geologic summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data obtained and compiled
during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, will be filed with form 3160-4.

officer (AQ).

C N\Loypans
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The anticipated completion program will be to test prospective zones in the Wasatch and
Mesa Verde, perforate, frac and/or acidize as necessary and place on production.

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to the BLM in Vernal on a
weekly basis.

7. ABNORMAL TEMPERATURES OR PRESSURES

a.

b.

The expected bottom hole pressure is 6825 psi.

No hydrogen sulfide gas is anticipated and no abnormal pressures or temperatures are
anticipated.

8. ANTICIPATED STARTING DATES AND NOTIFICATION OF OPERATIONS

a.

Drilling will commence immediately upon approval of this application, due to a pending farm
out expiration on May 1, 2003.

It is anticipated that the drilling of this well will take approximately 35 days.

The BLM in Vemal, Utah shall be notified of the anticipated date of location construction
commencement and of anticipated spud date.

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior
approval of the AQ. If operations are to be suspended, prior approval of the AO will be
obtained and notification given before resumption of operations.

The spud date will be reported orally to the AQ within 48 hours after spudding. If the
spudding occurs on a weekend or holiday, the report will be submitted on the following regular
work day. The oral report will be followed up with a Sundry Notice.
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f. In accordance with Onshore Qil and Gas Order No. 1, this well will be reported on Form 3160-

6 "Monthly Report of Operations", starting with the month in which operations commence and
continue each month until the well is physically plugged and abandoned. This report will be
filed with the Vernal BLM District Office, 170 South 500 East, Vernal, UT 84078.

g. Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual occurrences
shall be promptly reported in accordance with the requirements of NTL-3A or its revision.

h. If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "Sundry Notice" Form 3160-
5 to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved
plan are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.

i, Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will be notified when the
wellis placed in a producing status. Such netification will be sent by telegram or other written

communications, not later than 5 days following the date on which the well is placed on
production.

j- Pursuant to Onshore Order No. 7, with the approval of the District Engineer, produced water
may be temporarily disposed of into unlined pits for a period of up to 90 days. During the
period so authorized, an application for approval of the permanent disposal method, along

with the required water analysis and other information, must be submitted to the District
Engineer.

k. Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees or operators are authorized to vent/flare gas during initial well
evaluation tests, not exceeding a period of 30 days or the production of 50 MMCF of gas,
whichever occurs first. An application must be filed with the District Engineer and approval
received, for any venting/flaring of gas beyond the initial 30 day or authorized test period.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.9.d.), shall be submitted to
the appropriate District Office within sixty (60) days of installation or first production,
whichever occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Order No. 3 shall
be adhered to. All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be
effectively sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (b.4.).
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m. A first production conference will be scheduled within 15 days after receipt of the first
production notice.
n. No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior approval of the AQ.

In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergency situations, oral approval
will be obtained from the SO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be
filed with the AO within 30 days following completion of the well for abandonment. This report
will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Final
abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by the
approved APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of
the AO or his representative, or the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.

0. Pursuant to Onshore Oil and Gas QOrder No. 1, lessees and operators have the responsibility
to see that their exploration, development, production, and construction operations are
conducted in a manner which conforms with applicable Federal laws and regulations and with
State and local laws and regulations to the extent that such State and local laws are
applicable to operations on Federal or Indian lands.

Bureau of Land Management
170 South 500 East
Vernal, Utah 84078
Phone: 435/781-4400 Fax: 435/781-4410
After Hours:
Ed Forsman Petroleum Engineer 435/828-7874
Kirk Fleetwood Petroleum Engineer 435/828-7875

\ 3
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Location Construction -
Location Completion -
Spud Notice

Casing String and
Cementing

BOP and Related
Equipment Tests

First Production -
Notice

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS
forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and access roads.
prior to moving on the drilling rig.
at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.

twenty-four (24) hours prior to running casing and
cementing all casing strings.

twenty-four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.

within five (5) business days after new well begins or

production resumes after well has been off production for more than
ninety (90) days.

The onsite inspection for the subject well site was conducted in May, 2002 with representatives of Conoco-
Phillips and Stan Qlmstead of the Bureau of Land Management.

1, EXISTING ROADS

a. The proposed well site is located approximately 26 miles southeast of Myton, Utah.

b. Directions to the location from Myton, Utah are as follows:

Proceed in a southwesterly direction from Myton, Utah along U.S. Highway 40
approximately 1.6 miles to the junction this road and an existing road to the south; Turn
left and proceed in a southerly then southeasterly a distance of approximately 12.5 miles
to the Castle Peak Mine. Tumn right and continue south for 6.8 miles to a fork in the road.
Turn left and proceed easterly for 2.4 miles, to another fork. Stay left and continue

NV &
PERMITCO
& 5%
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easterly, then southeasterly for 2.2 miles to a fork in the road. Turn right and proceed
southwesterly for 1.6 miles. Tumn left and proceed southeasterly for 1.3 miles to the
Pendragon DSF #1-20. Turn right and proceed southwesterly for 1.1 miles. Turn right
onto the new access road (flagged) and proceed southwesterly a distance of
approximately 1300 feet to the location. .

C. For location of access roads within a 2-Mile radius, see Maps A & B.

d. Improvement to existing main roads will not be required.

e. All existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair during all drilling and
completion operations associated with this well.

f. Existing roads and newly constructed roads on surface under the jurisdiction of any
Surface Managing Agency shall be maintained in accordance with the standards of the
SMA,

2. PLANNED ACCESS ROADS

a. The last 1300 feet prior to entering the well pad will be new construction. The remainder
of the road from the Pendragon DSF #1-20 well has been recently constructed by
Pendragon to access their #7-30 wellsite.

b. The maximum grade of the new construction will be approximately 8%.

c. No turnouts are planned.

d. One low water crossing will be necessary as shown on Map B. There are no major cuts
and fills. No culverts and/or bridges will be required.

e. The last 1300 feet of new access road was centerline flagged at the time of staking.

f. The use of surfacing material is not anticipated, however it may be necessary depending

on weather conditions.

g. No cattle guards will be necessary.

\ 2
PERMITCO
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h.

Surface disturbance and vehicular travel will be limited to the approved location and
approved access route. Any additional area needed will be approved in advance.

Access roads and surface disturbing activities will conform to standards outfined in the
Bureau of Land Management and Forest Service publication: Surface Operating
Standards for Qil and Gas Exploration and Development, (1989).

The road will be constructed/upgraded to meet the standards of the anticipated traffic flow
and all weather road requirements. Construction/upgrading shall include ditching,
draining, graveling, crowing and capping the roadbed as necessary to provide a well
constructed safe road. Prior to upgrading, the road shall be cleared of any snow cover
and allowed to dry completely. Traveling off the 30 foot right-of-way will not be allowed.
Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creek drainage crossing type.
Crossings shall be designed so they will not cause siltation or accumulation of debris in
the drainage crossing nor shall the drainages be blocked by the roadbed. Erosion of
drainage ditches by runoff water shall be prevented by diverting water off at frequent
intervals by means of cutouts. Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions.
Should mud holes develop, they shall be filled in and detours around them avoided.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title IIl in an amount equal to or greater
than 10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually
in association with the drilling of this well. Furthermore, no extremely hazardous
substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be used,
produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling of this well.

We are requesting that the APD be used as our requested for road right of way for
portions of access located outside Lease No. UTU-74408. Attached is our check in the
amount of $175.00 to cover the minimum application and monitoring fees for this well.

LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHIN A 1-MILE RADIUS OF THE PROPOSED LOCATION.

(See Map “C")

a.

b.

Water wells - none

Injection wells - none
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Producing wells - two

Drilling wells - none

Shut-in wells - none

Temporarily abandoned wells - none
Disposal wells -none

Abandoned wells - none

Dry Holes - none

Other Proposed Locations - three

LOCATION OF TANK BATTERIES AND PRODUCTION FACILITIES,

a.

All permanent structures (onsite for six months or longer) constructed or installed
(including oil well pump jacks) will be painted Desert Brown. Al facilities will be painted

within six months of installation. Facilities required to comply with the Occupational Safety
and Health Act (OSHA) will be excluded.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed on this lease, the facility/battery or the
well pad shall surrounded by a containment dike of sufficient capacity to contain at a
minimum, the entire contents of the largest tank within the facility/battery, unless more
stringent protective requirements are deemed necessary by the authorized officer.

If production is established, a proposed production layout along with a Sundry Notice, will
be submitted for approval, prior to construction of facilities.

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.

Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 500 feet of the wellhead. The gas flow
line will be buried or anchored down from the wellhead to the meter and 500 feet
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downstream of the meter run or any production facilities. Meter runs will be housed
and/or fenced.

f. The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location. The oil and
gas meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. Tests for meter accuracy will
be conducted monthiy for the first three months on new meter installations and at least
quarterly thereafter. The AO will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports
will be submitted to the Vernal Field Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform

with Onshore Qil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil and Gas
Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement.

g. If at any time the facilities located on public land and authorized by the terms of the lease
are no longer included in the lease (due to a contraction in the unit or other lease or unit
boundary change), BLM will process a change in authorization to the appropriate statute.

The authorization will be subject to appropriate rental or other financial obligation as
determined by the authorized officer.

h. Any necessary pits will be properly fenced to prevent any wildlife entry.
i All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations will be adhered to.

j. All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease will
have prior written approval from the District Manager.

k. All access roads will be maintained as necessary to prevent erosion and accommodate
year-round traffic.

The road will be maintained in a safe useable condition.

5. LOCATION AND TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY

a. The proposed water source will be the Nebecker Water Service at the Nebecker Water
Station in Myton. The Water Use Claim # is 43-1723.
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b. Water will be hauled by Nebecker Water Service to the location over the access roads
shown on Maps A and B.
C. No water well will be drilled on this lease.
6. SOURCE OF CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL
a. Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized.
b. Any gravel used will be obtained from a commercial source.
C. The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform with 43 CFR 3610.2.3.
Construction material will not be located on lease.
d. No construction materials will be removed from Federal land.
7. METHODS OF HANDLING WASTE DISPOSAL
a. The reserve pit will be constructed so as not to leak, break, or allow discharge.
b. At the request of the BLM, the reserve pit will be lined with a 12 mil liner. If fractured rock

is encountered, the pit will be first lined with sufficient bedding (either straw or dirt) to
cover any rocks. The liner will overlap the pit walls and be covered with dirt and/or rocks
to hold it in place. No trash, scrap pipe, etc., that could puncture the liner will be disposed

of in the pit. More stringent protective requirements may be deemed necessary by the
A.Q.

C. Burning will not be allowed. All trash will be contained in a trash cage and its contents
removed at the end of drilling operations and hauled to an approved disposal sight.

d. Atter first production, produced waste water will be confined to a unlined pit or storage
tank for a period not to exceed ninety (90) days. During the 90-day period, in accordance
with Onshore Order No. 7, an application for approval of a permanent disposal method
and location, along with the required water analysis, will be submitted for the AQ's

approval. Failure to file an application within the time allowed will be considered an
incident of noncompliance.
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e. Drill cuttings are to be contained and buried in the reserve pit.

f. Any salts and/or chemicals which are an integral part of the drilling system will be
disposed of in the same manner as the drilling fluid.

g. A chemical porta-toilet will be furnished with the drilling rig.

h. The produced fluids will be produced into a test tank until such time as construction of
production facilities is completed. Any spills of oil, gas salt water or other produced fluids
will be cleaned up and removed.

8. ANCILLARY FACILITIES

There are no airstrips, camps, or other facilities planned during the drilling of the proposed well.
9. WELL SITE LAYOUT

a.

The operator or his/her contractor shall contact the BLM Office at 435/781-4400 forty-
eight (48) hours prior to construction activities.

The reserve pit will be located on the north west side of the location.

The flare pit will be located on the north side, a minimum of 100 feet from the well head
and 30 feet from the reserve pit fence.

The stockpiled topsoil (first six inches) will be stored on the west and south sides of the
location, along with Corner 6 on the northeastern corner. Topsoil along the access route
will be wind rowed on the uphill side.

Access to the well pad will be from the northeast as shown on the Pit & Pad Layout,
See Location Layout for orientation of rig, cross section of drill pad and cuts and fills.

The location of mud tanks; reserve pit, trash cage; pipe racks; living facilities and soil
stockpiles will be shown on the Location Layout.




ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1 CONFIDENTIAL - TIGHT HOLE

GASCO Energy, Inc.

Federal #22-30-10-18 Lease No. UTU-74408

1968' FNL and 2161' FWL

SE NW Sec. 30, T10S - R18E SURFACE USE PLAN

Uintah County, Utah Page 8
h. All pits will be fenced according to the following minimum standards:

1. 39 inch net wire shall be used with at least one strand or barbed wire on top of
the net wire (barbed wire is not necessary if pipe or some type of reinforcement
rod is attached to the top of the entire fence).

2. The net wire shall be no more than 2-inches above the ground. The barbed wire
shall be 3-inches above the net wire. Total height of the fence shall be at least
42-inches.

3. Corner posts shall be cemented and/or braced in such a manner to keep the

fence tight at all times.

4, Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be used between the corner braces.
Maximum distance between any two posts shall be no greater than 16 feet.

5. All wire shall be stretched, by using a stretching device, before it is attached to
the corner posts.

The reserve pit fencing will be on three sides during drilling operations and on the fourth
side when the rig moves off the location. Pits will be fenced and maintained until cleanup.

10. PLANS FOR RESTORATION OF SURFACE

Producing Location

a.

Immediately upon well completion, the location and surrounding area will be cleared of all
unused tubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash and junk not required for production.

Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons on the pit shall be removed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-1.

It a plastic nylon reinforced liner is used it shall be torn and perforated before backfilling of
the reserve pit.

Pl‘ Rl ll’l'(‘()
NGy’
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d.

1.

12.

The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production facilities or
operations will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours. The reserve pit will be
reclaimed within 120 days from the date of well completion. Before any dirt work takes

place, the reserve pit must have all fluids and hydrocarbons removed and all cans,
barrels, pipe, etc., will be removed.

Reclamation of unused disturbed areas on the well pad/access road no longer needed for
operations, such as cut slopes, and fill areas will be accomplished by grading, leveling
and seeding as recommended by the Authorized Officer. A seed mixture will be specified
by the Bureau of Land Management in their Conditions of Approval for the subject well.

Seeding will be performed immediately after the location has been reclaimed and the pit

has been backfilled, regardless of the time of year. Seed will be broadcast and walked in
with a dozer.

The topsoil stockpile will be seeded as soon as the location has been constructed with the
same recommended seed mix. The seed will be walked in with a cat.

Dry Hole

h.

At such time as the well is plugged and abandoned, the operator shall submit a

subsequent report of abandonment and BLM will attach the appropriate surface
rehabilitation conditions of approval.

SURFACE OWNERSHIP

Access Roads - The majority of the access roads are maintained by the County Road Department
or the Bureau of Land Management.

Well pad - The well pad is located on lands managed by the BLM.

OTHER INFORMATION

a.

A Class lll archeological survey has been conducted by Montgomery Archeological

Services. No significant cultural resources were found and clearance is recommended. A
copy of this report is attached.
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b. A Paleontological Resource Inventory Report was prepared by Rod Scheetz, Ph.D.

Significant paleontological findings will not be impacted by the construction of this wellsite.

C. The operator is responsible for informing all persons in the areas who are associated with
this project that they will be subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbing historic or
archaeological sites, or for collecting artifacts. If historic or archaeological materials are
uncovered during construction, the operator is to immediately stop work that might further

disturb such materials, and contact the authorized officer (AO). Within five working days
the AQ will inform the operator as to:

-whether the materials appear eligible for the National Register of Historic Places;

-the mitigation measures the operator will likely have to undertake before the site can be
used (assuming in situ preservation is not necessary); and

-a time frame for the AQ to complete and expedited review under 36 CFR 800.11 to
confirm, through the State Historic Preservation Officer, that the findings of the AO are
correct and that mitigation is appropriate. If the operator wishes, at any time, to relocate
activities to avoid the expense of mitigation and/or the delays associated with this
process, the AQ will assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization of
the exposed materials may be required. Otherwise, the operator will be responsible for
mitigation costs. The AQ will provide technical and procedural guidelines for the conduct
of mitigation. Upon verification from the AQ that required mitigation has been completed,
the operator will then be allowed to resume construction.

d. The operator will control noxious weeds along rights-of-way for roads, pipelines, well sites,
or other applicable facilities. A list of noxious weeds may be obtained from the BLM, or
the appropriate County Extension Office. On BLM administered land it is required that a
Pesticide Use Proposal shall be submitted, and given approval, prior to the application of
herbicides or other pesticides or possible hazardous chemicals.

e. Drilling rigs and/or equipment used during drilling operations on this wellsite will not be
stacked or stored on Federal Lands after the conclusion of drilling operations or at any
other time without BLM authorization. However, if BLM authorization is obtained, it is only

a temporary measure.
A2

PERMITCO
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f. All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is

made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approved
plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees. The operator is fully
responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be
furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

g. A complete copy of the approved APD shall be on location during construction of the
location and drilling activities.

h. There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover program without
prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. Al
wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended or abandoned will be identified in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.

i "Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for approval for all
changes of plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.3-2.

j- This permit will be valid for a period of one year from the date of approval. An extension
period may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.

After permit termination, a new application will be filed for approval for any future
operations.

k. The operator or his contractor shall contact the BLM Offices at 435/781-4400 48 hours
prior {0 construction activities.

The BLM Office shall be notified upon site completion prior to moving on the drilling rig.

13. LESSEE'S OR OPERATOR'S REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION

Permit Matters Drilling & Completion Matters
PERMITCO INC. GASCO Energy, Inc.
14421 County Road 10 14 Inverness Drive East, Suite H-236

Ft. Lupton, CO 80621 Englewood, CO 80112
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303/857-9999 (O) 303/483-0044 (O)

303/857-0577 (F) 303/ 483-0011(F)
Lisa Smith

CERTIFICATION

| hereby certify that |, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site and access route; that | am familiar with the conditions which presently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and, that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by GASCO Energy, Inc.
and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with the plan and the terms and conditions
under which it is approved.

This statement is subject to the provisions of 18.U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

February 25, 2003 . ‘IZ»/( LA 7//#% /L A
Date: Lisa'L. Smith - PERMITCO INC.
Authorized Agent for:
GASCO Energy, Inc.




Any wildlife stipulations that pertain to this lease will be attached as a
Conditional of Approval by the Bureau of Land Management.
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NEAR LITTLE DESERT, UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH
by
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INTRODUCTION

A cultural resource inventory was conducted by Montgomery Archaeological Consultants
(MOAC) for Phillips Petroleum's four 40-acre parcels for proposed well locations and associated
road and pipelines near Little Desert, Uintah County, Utah (Figure 1). The survey area is located
approximately 25 miles south of Myton, Utah. The proposed well locations are Phillips Petroleum’s
22-30-18#1, 43-17-23 #1, 22-20-24 #1, and 22-7-10 #1. The survey was impiemented at the
request of Mr. Jon Holst, permitting agent for Phillips Petroleum Company, Englewood, Colorado.

The project area is on land administered by the Bureau of Land Management (BLM), Vernal Field
Office.

The objectives of the inventory were to locate, document, and evaluate any cultural
resources within the project area in accordance with Section 106 of 36 CFR 800, the National
Historic Preservation Act of 1966 (as amended). Also, the inventory was implemented to attain
compliance with a number of federal and state mandates, including the National Environmental and
Historic Preservation Act of 1969, the Archaeological and Historic Conservation Act of 1972, the

Archaeological Resources Protection Act of 1979, and the American Indian Religious Freedom Act
of 1978.

The fieldwork was performed by Keith R. Montgomery, assisted by Jacki Montgomery, on
May 6, through May 8, 2002. The work was conducted under the auspices of U.S.D.I. (FLPMA)
Permit No. 02-UT-60122 and State of Utah Antiquities Project (Survey) No. U-02-MQ-0289b. On
May 7, 2002 a file search for previous projects and documented cultural resources was conducted
by the author at the Bureau of Land Management, Vernal Field Office. This consultation indicated
that a limited number of inventories have been conducted near the project area. In 1994, Metcalf
Archaeological Consultants conducted an inventory of the Little Desert Seismic Line for Reliable
Exploration, finding no cultural resources (Scott 1994). Senco-Phenix inventoried the Desert
Spring #3-29-10-18 well location near the current project area, for Chandler and Associates in
1998, locating no cultural resources (Senulis 1998). MOAC completed an inventory of a Philips
Petroleum well location (#22-24-1) in 2001, finding no cultural resources (Kinnear-Ferris 2001).
In 2002, MOAC completed an inventory of the Pete’'s Wash 14-18-2-1 well location for Phillips
Petroleum, documenting a prehistoric isolated find of artifact (Kinnear-Ferris 2002a). MOAC
inventoried two gas gathering pipelines in the area, for Phillips Petroleum, also in 2002, resulting
in no cultural resources (Kinnear-Ferris 2002b). Also in 2002, MOAC inventoried three forty acre
parcels in the Little Desert Area for Phillips Petroleum, finding six new archaeological sites:
42Dc1459, 42Un3011, 42Un3012, 42Un3013, 42Un3014, and 42Un3015 (Kinnear-Ferris and Ball

2002). These included two prehistoric sites, one ethnographic (Ute) site, and three historic sites.
None of these sites occur in the current project area.
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Figure 1. Inventory Area of Phillips Petroleum’s Four Forty Acre Parcels Near Little Desert, Uintah
County, Utah. USGS 7.5' Crow Knoll, Utah 1985. Scale 1:24000.
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DESCRIPTION OF PROJECT AREA

Environmental Setting

The project area lies approximately 25 miles south of Myton, west of the Green River, and
south of Eightmile Flat, in the Little Desert area of the Uinta Basin. The legal is Township 10
South, Range 18 East, Sections 7, 17, 19, 20, and 30. In general, the study area is situated within
the Tavaputs Plateau division of the Uintah Basin physiographic province (Stokes 1986).
Topographically, this area consists of highly dissected ridges with sandstone knolls and ledges.
The upper Eocene Uinta Formation is composed of eroded outcrops formed by fluvial deposited
stream laid interbedded sandstone and mudstone. This formation is known for its fossiliferous
nature and distinctive mammalian fauna of mid-Eocene Age, and is the type formation for the
Uintan Land Mammal Age (Wood et al. 1941). Common vertebrates include turtles, crocodilians,
fish, and some mammals. The nearest permanent water source is the Green River, east of the
project area. Named intermittent drainages in the area include Sheep Wash, Desert Spring Wash,
Pete's Wash, and Fourmile Wash. The elevation ranges from 5280 to 5500 feet a.s.|. Vegetation
includes those species found in a Shadscale Desert Community, including greasewood, shadscale,
rabbitbrush, snakeweed, prickly pear cactus, Indian ricegrass, and other grasses, with a riparian

Community including tamarisk in the washes. Modern disturbances include oil/gas development,
livestock grazing, and roads.

Cultural Overview

The cultural-chronological sequence represented in the study areaincludes the Paleoindian,
Archaic, Fremont, Protohistoric, and Euro-American stages. The earliest inhabitants of the region
are representative of the Paleoindian stage (ca. 12,000-8,000 B.P.). This stage is characterized
by the adaptation to terminal Pleistocene environments and by the exploitation of big game fauna.
The presence of Paleoindian hunters in the Uinta Basin region is implied by the discovery of Clovis
and Folsom fluted points (ca.12,000 B.P. - 10,000 B.P.), as well as the more recent Plano Complex
lanceolate points (ca. 10,000 B.P. - 7,000 B.P.). However, no such artifacts have been recovered
in stratigraphic or chronometrically controlled contexts in northeastern Utah.

The Archaic stage (ca. 8,000 B.P. - 1,500 B.P.) is characterized by peoples depending on
a foraging subsistence strategy, seasonally exploiting a wide spectrum of plant and animal species
in different ecozones. The shift to an Archaic lifeway was marked by the appearance of new
projectile point types perhaps reflecting the development of the atlatl in response to a need to
pursue smaller and faster game (Holmer 1986). In the Uinta Basin, evidence of widespread Early
Archaic exploitation is relatively sparse compared to the subsequent Middle and Late Archaic
periods. Early Archaic (ca. 6000-3000 B.C.) sites in the basin include sand dune sites and
rockshelters clustered mainly in the lower White River drainage as well as along the Green River
in the Browns Park and Flaming Gorge (Spangler 1995:373). Projectile points recovered from
Uinta Basin contexts include Pinto Series, Humboldt, Elko Series, Northern Side-notched, Hawken
Side-notched, Sudden Side-notched and Rocker Base Side-notched points. Excavated sites in the
area with Early Archaic components include Deluge Shelter in Dinosaur National Monument, and
open campsites along the Green River and on the Diamond Mountain piateau (Spangler 1995:374).
The Middle Archaic period (ca. 3000-500 B.C.) is characterized by improved climatic conditions and



increased human populations on the northern Colorado Plateau. Several stratified Middle Archaic
sites have been excavated and dozens of sites have been documented in the Uinta Basin. Middle
Archaic sites in the area reflect cultural influences from the Plains, although a Great Basin and/or
northern Colorado Plateau influence is represented in the continuation of the Elko Series projectile
points. Subsistence data from Middle Archaic components indicate gathering and processing of
plants as well as faunal exploitation (e.g., mule deer, antelope, bighorn sheep, cottontail rabbit,
muskrat, prairie dog, beaver and birds). The Late Archaic period (ca. 500 B.C.-A.D. 550) in the
Uinta Basin s distinguished by the continuation of Elko Series atlat! points with the addition of semi-
subterranean residential structures at base camps. By about A.D. 100, maize horticulture and
Rose Springs arrow points had been added to the Archaic lifeway. In the Uinta Basin, evidence
of Late Archaic architecture occurs at the Cockleburr Wash Site (42Un1476) where a temporary
structure, probably a brush shelter, yielded a date of 316 B.C. The structure was probably
associated with seasonal procurement of wild floral resources gathered along Cliff Creek.

The Formative stage (A.D. 500-1300) is represented in the area by the Uinta Fremont, as
first termed by Marwitt (1970). This stage is characterized by a reliance upon domesticated corn
and squash, increasing sedentism, and in its later periods, substantial habitation structures, pottery,
and bow and arrow weapon technology. Based on the evidence from Caldwell Village, Boundary
Village, Deluge Shelter, Mantles Cave and others, the temporal range of the Uinta Fremont
appears to be from A.D. 650 to 950. This variant is characterized by shallow, saucer-shaped
pithouse surface structures with randomly placed postholes and off-center firepits, some of which
were adobe-rimmed. Traits considered unique or predominate to the Uinta Basin include calcite-
tempered pottery, two-handled wide-mouth vessels, Utah type metates, the use of gilsonite for
pottery repair, settlement on tops of buttes and large-shouldered bifaces (Shields 1970).

Archaeological evidence suggests that Numic peoples appeared in east-central Utah at
approximately A.D. 1100 or shortly before the disappearance of Formative-stage peoples (Reed
1994). The archaeological remains of Numic-speaking Utes consist primarily of lithic scatters with
low quantities of brown ware ceramics, rock art, and occasional wickiups. The brown ware
ceramics appear to be the most reliable indicator of cultural affiliation, as Desert Side-notched and
Cottonwood Triangular points were manufactured by other cultural groups beside the Ute (Horn,
Reed, and Chandler 1994:130). The Ute appear to have been hunter and gatherers exploiting
various fauna and flora resources. According to macrobotanical and faunal data from dated
components deer, elk, pronghorn, bison, and small game were acquired (Reed 1994:191). Plant
materials thought to have been exploited for food include goosefoot, grass seeds, pinyon nuts,

juniper berries, squawbush berries and leaves, hackberry seeds and possibly saltbush seeds,
knotweed, chokecherry, and chickweed (Ibid 191).

The cultural history of the Eastern Ute, comprising the bands living east of the Green River,
has been divided into four phases (Reed 1988). The earliest and most tenuous phase is the
Chipeta Phase, dated between ca. 1250 and 1400. Diagnostic artifacts include Desert Side-
notched, Cottonwood Triangular, and small corner-notched arrow points and possibly Shoshonean
knives. The Canalla phase (ca. A.D. 1400-1650) designates the period between the appearance
of well-dated Uncompahgre brown ware ceramics and the adoption of an equestrian lifeway.
Diagnostic artifacts include Uncompahgre Brown Ware ceramics, Desert Side-notched and
Cottonwood Triangular points, and Shoshonean knives. The pedestrian hunter and gatherers
probably lived in wickiups. Near the end of the phase, some groups may have obtained trade items
from Spanish settlements in New Mexico (Horn, Reed, and Chandler 1994:131). The Antero phase
(ca. A.D. 1650-1881) represents a shift to a fully equestrian lifestyle and integration of
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Euroamerican trade goods into Ute material culture. The horse permitted hunting of bison on the
Plains and led to an increase in the importance of raiding for economic gain. Tepees, as well as
wickiups, were inhabited. (Ibid 131).

The early Utes in Uintah County were Uinta-ats, a small band of a few hundred members
(Burton 1996:20). In pre-horse days, Ute family groups lived largely independently of others with
key gathering, hunting, and fishing sites being communal and granted to all, within both the local
and extralocal Ute communities (Ibid 340). According to Smith's (1974) informants both deer and
buffalo were important game for the White River Ute band. Before the buffalo became extinct in
the Uintah Basin in the 1830s, the Ute would make trips northeast of Fort Bridger in the vicinity of
what is now Rock Springs and Green River, Wyoming using the horse to surround and drive the
buffalo over a precipice (Callaway, Janetski, and Stewart 1986; Smith 1974). All Ute groups made

tripod or conical houses with a three or four-pole foundation and a circular ground plan some 10
to15 feet in diameter with covering brush or bark.

The first Euro-Americans in the Uinta Basin were Spanish missionaries, traveling between
Sante Fe, New Mexico up through western Colorado, towards the Utah Valley, and on to California.
In 1776, under the leadership of Fray Francisco Atanasio Dominguez and Fray Silvestre Velez de
Escalante, the Spanish commenced to explore a northern route from Santa Fe to the garrison of
Monterey on the California coast (Spangler et al. 1995). Euro-American traders were another early
factor in the history of the Uinta Basin. Some of these were Spaniards, who continued to visit the
region until the Mexican war of independence in 1821, when most Spanish were expelled from the
Southwest. It was the beaver trade in the early part of the nineteenth century, that cemented trade
with Ute and Shoshone in the area, and resulted in the establishment of trading posts along the
major rivers in the area, including the Duchesne, Green, and Uinta (Spangler et al. 1995).

The settlement of the Uinta Basin differs from that of much of Utah in that early settiement
in the area occurred around Indian “agencies” assigned to the Uinta and Ouray Reservations,
rather than under the direction of the Mormon church (Spangier et al. 1995). These agencies
consisted of cabins and a trading post with farms cropping up around the agency, and were
directed by a government Indian agent. The first agency was constructed at the mouth of Daniels
Canyon in 1864, and was moved several times before 1868. The Mormon church, under Brigham
Young consigned survey parties to the Uinta Basin in the early 1860s, determining that the land

was not very suitable for cultivation. For this reason, Mormon occupation of the area occurred later
than in many parts of the state.

in 1888, a road and telegraph line was completed through Nine Mile Canyon, connecting
the towns of Price and Fort Duchesne. The road was used by a stage line to transport passengers
and mail, and used by freighters to haul gilsonite from the Uinta Basin to Price. The road crossed
many benches and drainages of the Tavaputs Plateau. There was no water for thirty-seven miles
of the route between Minnie Maud Creek and the Duchesne River. In 1891, Owen Smith located

a well in site in Gamma Grass Canyon and established a way station, later known as The Wells
Draw (Barton 1998:70-75).

By the early 1920Q's, the Tavaputs Plateau region attracted ranchers requiring additional
grazing lands for cattle, horses, and sheep. This region provided unregulated grazing areas of
open range consisting of gamma grass mixed with crested wheat. Overgrazing led to the

eradication of much of these grasses and the resulting erosion led to the creation of deep gullies
and washes (Barton 1998:139).



SURVEY METHODOLOGY

Anintensive pedestrian survey, considered 100% coverage, was performed for this project.
The archaeologists walked parallel transects across the four 40 acre inventory parcels, and the 100
ft wide access route corridors, spaced no more than 10 m (30 ft) apart. A total of 178.8 acres was
inventoried that occurs on BLM administered land, Vernal Field Office.

Cultural resources were recorded as an archaeological site or isolated find of artifacts (IFs).
Archaeological sites were defined as spatially definable areas with features and/or ten or more
artifacts. Sites were documented by the archaeologists walking transects across the site, spaced
no more than 3 m apart, and marking the locations of cultural materials with pinflags. This
procedure allowed clear definition of site boundaries and artifact concentrations. Atthe completion
of the surface inspection, a Brunton compass was employed to point-provenience diagnostic
artifacts and other relevant features in reference to the site datum, a steel rebar stamped with a
temporary site number. Archaeological sites were plotted on a 7.5 USGS quadrangle,
photographed, with site data entered on an Intermountain Antiquities Computer System (IMACS,
1990 version) inventory form (Appendix A). Isolated finds are defined as individual artifacts or light
scatter of items, which lack sufficient material culture to warrant IMACS forms, or to derive
interpretation of human behavior in a cultural and temporal context.

INVENTORY RESULTS
The inventory of the proposed Phillips Petroleum Company’s four 40-acre parcels and
access routes near Little Desert resulted in the finding of one isolated find of artifact (IF-A).
Isolated Find of Artifacts
Isolated Find A (IF-A) is located in the SW/SE/NW of Section 7, T 10S, R 18E (UTM
290671E/4423512N). lt is a gray opaque chert secondary core reduction stage lithic flake.
MANAGEMENT RECOMMENDATIONS
The cultural resource inventory for Phillips Petroleum Company’s four forty-acre parcels
and access routes resulted in the documentation of on isolated find of artifact. This cultural

resource is considered to be not eligible for inclusion to the NRHP. Based on the findings, a

determination of "no historic properties affected" is proposed for this project pursuant to Section
1086, CFR 800.
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Introduction

At the request of Jon Holst, of Jon D Holst & Associates, as recommended by Blaine
Phillips of the BLM, a paleontological inventory survey of four quarter-sections (SW Section 7,
SE Section 17, NW Section 20, NW Section 30, T10S, R18E, in the Crow Knoll USGS
Quadrangle, Uinta County, Utah, [Fig. 1])was conducted by Rod Scheetz and crew on 2-6 May
2002. The survey was conducted for Phillips Petroleum under Paleontological Resources Use
Permit #UT-S-01-004. This survey to locate, identify and evaluate paleontological resources was
done to meet requirements of Executive Order 11593, The National Environmental Act of 1969,
and other Federal laws and regulations that protect paleontological resources.
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Figure 1. Highlighted quarter-sections surveyed for paleontological
resources. Sections include SW Sec. 7, SE Sec. 17, NW Sec. 20, and NW

Sec. 30, T108, R18E, within the Crow Knoll USGS Quadrangle, Uintah
County, Utah. Scale: 1" = 1 mile.




Federal and State Requirements

As mandated by the US Department of the Interior Bureau of Land Managerent,
paleontologically sensitive geologic formations included in BLM lands involved in exchanges need
be evaluated for their paleontological resources. This requirement complies with:

1) The Historic Sites Act of 1935 (P.L. 74-292; 49 Stat. 666, 16 U.S.C. 461 et seq.);

2) The National Environmental Policy Act of 1969 (NEPA)(P.L. 91-190; 31 Stat. 852,
42 1J.S.C. 44321-4327);

3) The Federal Land Policy and Management Act of 1976 (P.L. 94-579; 90 Stat, 2743,
U.S.C. 1701-1782);

4) Under policy dictated by the BLM paleontology planning mitigation document IM-96-

67 (4 March 1996) formations are ranked according to their paleontological potential:

» Condition 1 is applied to those areas known to contain fossil localities, and special
consideration of the known resources is in need of evaluation. '

» Condition 2 is applied to areas that have exposures of geologic rock units known to
have produced fossils elsewhere.

» Condition 3 are areas unlikely to produce fossils based on surficial geology.

Although these guidelines apply mostly to vertebrate fossils, they are equally designed to
help protect rare plant and invertebrate fossils, especially “type” localities. Likewise,
many fossils, though common and unimpressive in and of themselves, can be important
paleo-environmental, depositional, and chronostratigraphic indicators.

PREVIOUS WORK

The Uinta Formation, within the Uinta Basin in northeast Utah, is composed primarily of
lacustrine sediments in the west, and fluvial clays, muds and sands in the east (Bryant et al, 1990;
Ruder et al, 1976). The Uintah Formation is well-known for its fossiliferous nature and distinctive
mammalian fauna of mid-Eocene Age, and is the type formation for the Uintan Land Mammal
Age (Wood et al, 1941).

Early stratigraphic work within the Uinta Formation focused on the definition of rock units
and attempted to define a distinction between early and late Uintan faunas (Riggs, 1912; Peterson
and Kay, 1931; Kay 1934). The emphasis in more recent decades focused on
magnetostratigraphy, radioscopic chronology, and continental biostratigraphy (Flynn 1986,
prothero, 1990; Prothero and Swisher, 1990; Prothero and Swisher, 1992; Walsh, 1996). (See
Walsh 1996 for recent review.) Previous consensus suggests early and late Unitan faunas
coincided with Uinta B and Uinta C rock respectively. However, this view is currently being
challenged and tested by workers from Washington University.

A paleontological survey was conducted for Phillips Petroleum on the SE/SW parcel of
Section 7 in March of 2001. Two significant localities were reported, both outside the proposed
well pad for Federal 24-7. Unl255V (UTM 590637.6 E, 4422811.9 N) — a brontotherian
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mammal site, and Un1256P (UTM 590607.1 E, 4422773.8 N) — a fossil wood site, were reported
as areas to avoid. Four turtle scatters within the parcel were reported as beyond recovery and no
special provisions were made to protect them (UTM 590915.6 E, 4422905.2 N; 590628.0 E,
4422802.4 N; 590641.4 E, 4422838.5 N; 590570.9 E, 4422949.0 N) The survey included the
proposed access road to Federal 24-7 and one turtle scatter (UTM 591416.5 E 4423151.0 N) was
located near the start of the access and a request was made to move the road slightly as to avoid
the site. On 25 March 2001, road and drill pad construction was monitored to ensure the
localities were avoided.

A paleontological survey along a proposed pipeline which traversed through the SE 1/4 of
Section 17 was conducted for Phillips Petroleum in August of 2001. No fossils were reported
from this area. )

In March of 2001, a paleontological survey was conducted for Pendragon Energy Partners on
NE/SE Section 17 and NW/NE Section 20. No significant fossils were reported but for a few
large bone fragments within the NE/SE of Section 17 (UTM 593210.0 E 4421849.0 N) at the
base of a thick sandstone unit near the top of a steep slope WNW of proposed well 17-9.

FIELD METHODS

Considerable effort was made to locate, identify and evaluate any and all significant fossils or
fossil horizons exposed within the designated boundary. Areas of prime attention were erosional
surfaces and fresh outcrops. These areas were surveyed for exposed vertebrate, invertebrate, and
plant fossils. Anthills were investigated to identify possible microvertebrate horizons that would
not otherwise be evident on weathered surfaces. Contacts along sandstone units provided several
invertebrate trace fossils. Fossil bone fragments are locally common within the area surveyed.
Most common are fossil turtle or tortoise fragments exhibiting various stages of deterioration.
Because of their abundance the majority of the turtle fragments were not recorded. However, all
fossil chelonians represented by a significant portion of an individual and those useful in
identifying fossiliferous horizons were recorded. The resistant nature of carapace and plastron
parts allows for a single deteriorated turtle to fragment and scatter over an area of up to ten
square meters (personal observation). Other vertebrate fossils will, on the other hand, deteriorate
completely in place and will not be noticed unless discovery is made during initial stages of
exposure. The presence of turtle fossils is indicative of favorable preservational conditions, and
their presence should not therefore be ignored. Only a cursory survey was performed on soil
horizons, because fossil fragments, although they may be common, are out of place and weathered
providing little information.

All localities on this project were documented and recorded using a Magellan GPS model 320
and electronically transferred to topographic quadrangle maps using All Topo Utah software.



(numbered) and Federal Well 24-7. Marked ‘1", locality Unl1350V is
highlighted and should be avoided. Previously known localities (4 through
9) are shown with area we reported on in 2001 to avoid near well 24-7.
Scale: 1" = 0.133 miles.

Geological and Paleontological Overview:

The geomorphology within the quarter sections surveyed is controlled by predominantly
fluvial sediments within Sections 7, becoming increasingly lacustrine southeast , especially in
Section 17 and 20. The more fluvial facies consists of numerous red/purple sandstone channel
deposits within green and red silty clays. Lacustrine facies consist of marls, laterally extensive
brown sandstone units marked by low crossbeds and soft-sediment deformation, and calcareous
mudstones and silts. Most of the outcrops occur on ridges and steep slopes. Flat-topped ridges
are almost entirely residuum of the underlying Uinta Formation bedrock. Gentle slopes are
predominantly covered in a veneer of colluvium and eolian sands, and drainage bottoms are
alluvial fill. :

Fossils seem to occur primarily in association with fluvial, or near-fluvial sediments.
Especially favorable conditions seem to apply within the distal deltaic sands which bear fossils that
were apparently brought in and dumped rapidly. Turtle shell fragments are abundant as colluvium
in Section 7, being isolated, eroded, and out of place. Turtle shell fragments are uncommon in
Sections 17 and 20, and are limited to baenid and Trionyx turtles. Testudo tortoises are
occasionally discovered in more terrestrial/fluvial sediments of Sections 7 and 30.



Survey Findings:

SW Section 7

Fossils vertebrate fossils and invertebrate traces are common in Section 7. Three localities
were discovered in addition to the six localities reported in March of 2001. One of the new
localities will be registered with the Utah Geological Survey as a significant vertebrate locality.

UTAH Unl1350V (marked as “1" and highlighted
n Fig 2)
UTM 590225 1M E 4423269 1M N Z 12
NW/NW/SW Section 7,
TI0OS,RISE
Artiodactyl (?7) limb and
jaw fragments with some
associated turtle shell
(Fig. 3 mset photo),
concentrated in a 30 ¢m .
scatter. The bones are e
alop a purplish gray silty
mudstone. about haif
way up the west-facing
slope of hill (Fig. 3).
about 30 m north of the
head of a decp drainage.
Although we did not
excavate to verify, the
concentration and
condition of bones
suggest the bones are at
its source. Slope is
moderately covered in
colluvium and basketball-
10 bushel-sized rocks that
have rolled or slid rom
the slope above.
Collected femur.
proximal tibla. and jaw
fragment. Jaw fragment
contains teeth with
proken crowns. Lot
other bone and turtie
shell fragments.
Constructed a foot-tall
inconspicuous rock cairn
itiiiﬂ;v(ﬁiigfam‘ for Figu re 3. Small mammal limb and jaw fragmermts (insct photo. dime for
' scale) tound on siope ot hill in the NW/NW/SW Section 7. T10S. R18E.
Locality UTAH Un1320V (arrow). View looking NNE.
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A turtle scatter occurs at UTM 590241.8M E 4423191.6M N, south of the previous locality
(marked “2" in Fig. 2), along the east side of a shallow drainage, in greenish-purple mudstone.
Siltstone units occur above the fossil horizon and the top surface of a clean sandstone is exposed
in the drainage a few meters below. The turtle shell is 3/8" thick, deteriorated into a 30 cm
scatter. Some remaining surface texture suggests a baenid-type turtle.

A 2 meter apron of turtle shell fragments occur on the west side of the prominent hill in the
southwest of Section 7 (marked *“3" in Fig. 2. UTM 590242.3 E 4422747.6 N). Fragments

originate from a reddish gray silty mudstone. Surface texture is of a baenid turtle, but what
remains is not recoverable.

Other localities within Section 7 and marked on Figure 2 (localities 4 through 9) were

previously reported from a survey conducted in March of 2001 and are discussed above in
“Previous Work™.

SE Section 17 & NW Section 20

Even isolated turtle shell fragments are uncommon in Sections 17 and 20. The only locality
worthy of note was previously reported in March 0f 2001 for Pendragon Energy. This locality
bears northeast of the proposed well pad 17-9 and occurs at the base of a deltaic sandstone unit,
high on the south edge of a steep slope (Fig. 4). An unidentified mammal vertebra and Testudo

tortoise shell occurs among bone fragments within the base of the sandstone unit and appears to
have been a result of a lag deposit.

NW Section 30

Three turtle localities were discovered within the northwest quarter of Section 30. Two of the

localities are concentrated fragments of turtles in a small scatter, both beyond recovery, and the
third consists of an internal mold of the carapace which is collectable.

The first turtle scatter in Section 30, UTM 590457.1M E 4419075.7M N (marked “11" in Fig.
53), occurs near the base of a north facing sparsely colluvium-covered, grassy slope. The slope is
very gradual here, but steepens to the south. Testudo fragments occur in a small scatter upon a

gray mudstone. The in situ source was not found, but the distribution and condition of the
fragments indicate the source is nearby.

The second turtle scatter in Section 30 (marked “12" in Fig. 5) occurs on the north slope of a
hill near the center of the NW quarter section (UTM 590593.3M E 4419009.0M N). The

fragments are a rusty tan in color and are dibbled down the hill for 3 to 4 meters. At the highest
pomt, fragments occur on a green-gray muddy siltstone,
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0.20 miles.

Figure 4. Quarter sections in the SE of Section 17 and the NW of Section 20 with a
proposed Pendragon well site 17-9 and bone fragments found at locality 10. Scale: 1" =
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Figure 5. NW quarter Section 30 showing numbered fossil localities and proposed
well site 22-30. Localities 13 (turtle carapace) & 14 (Umtathere) are highlighted and
are to be avoided. Scale: 1" =0.1667 miles.

UTAH Un1391V (marked “13" and
highlighted in Fig. 5)

UTM 590976.4M E 4419376.1M N
NE/NE/NW Section 30, T10S, R18E
An internal mold of the carapace of a
Trionyx turtle (Fig. 6) occurs along the
south side of a hill, in a brown medium-
grained sandstone block that had fallen
from a sandstone outcrop (Fig. 7) some
10 meters up slope near top of hill. Mold
exposed on the downhill end of 1.5 x 3
meter sandstone block. Although nearly
all of the turtle shell is gone, the internal
mold identifies it as Trionyx.
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Figure 6. Internal mold of carapace of Trionvx
turtle within end of sandstone block. Penny for
scale.



Flgu re 7. Location of Un1391V, Trionyx carapace mold in sandstone block fallen from
outcrop at top of hill (arrow). View from below looking NW.

UTAH Un1392V (marked “14" and highlighted in Fig. 5)

UTM 590897.3M E 4419073.6M N

NW/SE/NW Section 30, T10S, R18E

Uintathere maxilla (Fig. 8), skull fragments, and femur end exposed in residuum near the south
edge of the top of a bench east of a prominent knoll (Fig. 9). Four badly deteriorated teeth in
maxilla and other bones are scattered in a localized area (Fig. 9 inset photo) within the top rubble
and m situ. Nothing appears articulated, but bones are concentrated/closely associated within a
brownish-green clay-rich coarse-medium-grained sandstone. Bones in matrix indicate they were
broken prior 1o 'fk' -"‘ "ﬂ T . ..'-v - JF",:_“ - o 4

burial. Other ' '
mammal bones
occur on the same
bench up to 12
meters away.
suggesting a
fossiliferous horizon
that bears significant
remains and good
paleontological
potential.

Figure 8. Uintathere maxilla with badly deteriorated teeth. Pen for scale.
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Figure 9. Location of Uintathere site Un1392V, near the W).
Bones occur in situ and in residuum (inset photo. pen for scale). View from top of knoil
iooking ESE.

Recommendations:

We reiterate the recommendation to avoid a small outcrop at Uni1Z53V and Uni286P. These
‘ocalities were identified in March of 2001 and represent a fossiliferous unit that should e
srotected. Based on the recent discovery of significant paleontoiogical remains. we recommend
avoiding three new localities and thelr surrounding areas — Uni1330V in Section 7. and Unl3%91V
& Un1392V in Section 30, These areas have been highlighted on the maps (Fig. 2 & 2). Both
Unl350V. a smal/medium-sized artiodactvl. and Unl391V, a turtle mold. appear to be
collectable. If these smail areas are in harms way due to development. we suggest the fossiis te
mitigated. However, Unl1392V represents a fossii horizon high on the upper bench of a hiil which
should be steered clear of. All other noted fossii localities are in such advanced stages 57
deterioration. there is no reasenabie chance oI 7eCovery,

R T oo
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14421 County Road 10 » Fort Luptan, Colorado ‘80621 + (303 857-9999  FAX (303) 857-0577 » E-MAN LSPermitco@aol-com

. February 25, 2003
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| GASCO Energy, inc A
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: PERMITCO INC.

. Lisa Smith _
- Consultant for -

 GASCO Energy, Inc. .

Enc, | | .
ce:  Gasco Energy, Inc. - Englewood, CO ~ RECEIVED
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Form 3160-3 ! ‘ ,1 FORM APPROVED
(Lagust 1999) -

2 OMB No. 1004-0136
UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-74408
6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe N
004 APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER NA oes T jribe Tame
la. Type of W()Tk:m DRILL D REENTER 7. If Unitor CA ement, Narme and No.
N/A
8. Lease Npfne and Well No.
b. Type of Well: Y 0it wet  [x] Gas went [ other Ixl single Zone  [[] Multiple Zone Fedéral #22-30-10-18
2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044 14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #H236 9. H#1 Well No.
GASCO Energy, In Englewood, CO 80112 L/'Z'O‘f 7. 344924
3. Name of Agent \ 303-857-9999 14421 County Road 10 /' 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
Permitco Inc. - Agent Fort Lupton, CO 80621 Wildeat Jrolt s/ 4 ady of
4. Location of Well (Report locationglearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T, R, M., or Blk, and Survey or Area
At surface 198 FNL and 2161 FWL F498%06Y  34.91¢ 7 Sec. 30, T10S-R18E
8 SVPWL S 40915% - 709. 95742 ’
At proposed prod. zone SE
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearmn or post office* / 12, County or Parish 13. State
Approximately 29.5 miles Southeastof Myton, UT Uintah "1
15. Dnstance from proposed™ 16. No. of Acres in leas 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
location to rigrcs{:he N
wspgttg nearest ¢ drig. unit line, if any) 196 1720 N/A
18. gl;rfétfrml?rglgﬁisgg’lgﬁ;ﬁ&;d’ \ 19. Proposed Pepth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
applied for, on this lease, ft. None 500:
’ Bond # 4127759
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22 ximate date work will start* 23, Estirnated duration
5442 GL g May 1, 2003 35 Days
I
\\\ 24, Attaatqents
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements nshore Qil and Gas OrdesNo. 1, shall be attached to this form:

Vi

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor.

4. Bond to covexthe operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan.

Item 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Jorest System Lands, 5. Operator certification.

SUPOQ shall be filed with the appropriate Forest #ervice Office. 6. Such other site specific infotxation and/or plans as may be required by the

CONFIDENTIAL-TIGHY HOLE suthorized offie

25. Signature \ Name (Printed/Typed) ! Date
4 IR | Lisa L. Smith | o512003
Title N
Authorized Agent for GASCO Energy, Inc.
Approved by (Signature) // i Name (Printed/Typed) l Date

Title {Office
1

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant 10
conduct operations thereon.

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

¥(Instructions on reverse)
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B3-13-2003 28:43 PERMITCO » 18813593940

NO. 738 rez

-
Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(Avgust 1599) OMB No. 1004-0136
UNITED STATES Expircs Noverober 30, 2000
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No,
002 BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-74408
i 6. If (ndian, Allonee or Tribe Name
ﬁPPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER NA
12 Type of Work: DRILL D REENTER 7. 17 Unit or CA Agrcemnent, Nar and No,
NA
8. Lanse Nome and Well No.
b. Typeofwen: [Jonwen [ Gas weit (] omer Gd single zone () Muliple Zone Federal #22-30-10-19
2. Name of Operator | $03-483-0044 14 Invernass Drive East, Sulte #1236 9. APIWell No. _
oy oy, 9 42 -047-349 24
GASCO Energy, Inc/ Pannonian Enargy, Inc. _ Englewood, CO 80112 [2 ¥
1. Name of Agens | 303-857-0999 12421 County Road 10 10, Fleld mnd ool or Explaratery
Permitco Inc, - Agent Fort Lupton, CO 80621 Wit Uil s o
3. Location of Well (Repert Location £learly and in accardance with any State roquirements.™) 11, Sec., T., R, M., or Bik, and Survey or Arc
At surfuce 1968 PNL and 2161 WL </ F3¢e Y F90i003 Sec. 30, T10S-RIBE
IR SRS Y, V- B R R 3:)
At proposed prod. zome SENW Gan SIS L )R ETY
14. Distnce in niles and dicectinn from nearest own or poat office® 12. County ot Parich 3. State
Aggmimaiol! 29.5 miles Southeast of Myton, UT Ulntah uT
+ RncE Tom 16, No. of Acres in eage ] 17. Spacing Unit dedicaied ta tns well
toantion w qe-;s{_m ‘ )
10| or ey , K-
lmnam drig. wnit ire, if any) 1968 1720 N/A
T2 Dleance trom proposal locanon” ; ) .
o n:”g;fl wgg‘%' g‘g?‘gﬁg o, 19, Proposed) Depth 20, BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
applied for, on this lease. .
None 12500 Bond ¥ 4127789
21, Elevatians (S-how;whether DF, KDB, KT, GL, &tc.) 22. Approximate dats wark wil starc¥ 23. Estimated duration
| su2 GL May 1,2003 35 Days
} 24, Attachments
The following, complrud in acgordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gag Order No. 1, ghall be Rinchied to this (orm:
1. Well plat cenified by u registered surveyur. 4 Bond to coverthe operations unless cavered by an existing bond on fils (se¢
2. A Drlling Plan, ‘ Tiem 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (i the location is on Natianal Forest System Lands,* 5. Operalor certification,
SUPO shall be filed with (he appropriate Rorest Service Office. 6. Such othor site specific information and/er plans as may be Tequired by the
suthorized office.
—— mg:_mﬂ;&'-——_:

W —

25. Signature } Name (Printed!Iyped) | Date
M 2 | Liga L. Smith L 2M26(2003
Tide il

Authorized Agent for GASCO Energy, Inc/ Pannonian Energy, inc.
Approved by (Signarure) I Nama (Primad/Typed)

Ty
"

]
Tirle Totfice
[}

Appliestion approva) does nol warcant or cestilly that the applicant hoids lega! or equitable title 1o those rights in the subjeet lease which would entitle the applicant to
conduct operations therzon.

Conditions of approval, il any, are asrached,

T T e LMY ]
Tite 18 U.S.C. sa'm 1007 and Title 43 U.S.C. Sestion 1212, muke it & erime for any person knowingty and willfully to make 1 any depariment of agency of the
United Stases any (tca, fietitlous ar fraudulent stalemants or représealalions ad (o any maner within its jorisdiction,
F— -

MEW

*(Instructions on reverse)

RECEIVED
R MAR 13 2003
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From: PermitCo Inc. “Fax Number: _ 303/857-0577
14:?1 County Road 10 Phone Number:  303/857-9999
Fort Lupton, CO 80621
Lisa L. Smith _
RECEIVED
MAR 1 3 2903
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q3/1?/209§ BG__S? PERMITCO + 18013593940 NO. 731 ral

STATE OF UTAH FORM 3
0 0 1 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES AMENDED REPORT 0O
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING (highlight changes)

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL
™ eeorworc  DRILLO0  REENTERD)  DEEPENT]

WA

e T GRS e
8, TYPE OF WELL: O|Lj|:] GAS(l OWER __ siNGLE 20NE 10 MULTIPLE ZONE 3 [ ;;: o CAA E!
|
TR Y GRERATOR R AT LT
BASCO Eueay,? Inc./ Pannonian Energy, Inc. Federal #22:30-10-18
3, TOR: >

10, FIELD AND BODL, OR WILDCAT:

14 invemess Drive

. QTATR, BECTION, TOW
)€ Gty 7, L prh]| MERDN:
AT SURFACE: 1968' FNL and 2187’ FWL =g oS D ROALE T Sec. 30, T108-R18E

AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONR: SENW

W T IN MILES ANG GIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST QFFICE! 2. COUNTY: 7. STATE:
Ag,n_rgximalel! 29.5 miles Southeast of Myton, UT Uintah UTAH
5. DNSTANCE 10 PROP LEASE LING (NEET) ™18, NUMBER OF ACRR IN LEASE: 7. NUMBER OF AGHES ASSIGNED TO :

1968 1720 N/A
o PETANCETO NEAREST WELL (GRILLING, COMPLETEG, GR | 19. PROPOSED ; o0, BOND DESCRIETION: -
AFPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET):
None 12,500 Bond # 4127759
mﬁm): TAPP & DA WILL START: RS TIMA TION:
sS4z GL 5/1/2003 35 Days
2. | PROPOSED CASING AND CEMENTING PROGRAM
S@E OF HOLE CABING SI2E, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETYING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY, VIELD. AND SLURRY WEIGHT
174" 13-3/8°, W40, 48¢ 220 260 sx Class G
12-12" . g-5m", )86, 404 3500 845 sx Hi-Fill and Class G
7-718" L &1/2", P110, 13,64 12,600’ 2250 sx Hi-Fill and POZ
r— = s 3% L
™ML\ .t v il
MAR-+3-2003—
25, ATTACHMENTS

TV, OF O, GRS X a1
VERIEY THE EOLLOWING ARE ATTACHED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAH OiL AN GAS CONSERVATION GENERAL AULES: )

WELL PLAT DR MAP PREPARED BY LICENSED SURVEYOR OR ENGINBAR COMPLETE DRILLING PROGRAM
O svioence of DIVISION OF WAYGR RIGHTS APPROVAL FOR USE OF WAYER [ FORMS, IF GRERATOR I§ PERSON OR COMPANY OTHER THAN THE LEASE GWNER
ABENT: Perm'tco l“c- AGENT'S PHONE NO.: 303-057’9'99
NAVE PLEASE oryy iSO L. Smith me _ Agent for GASCO Energy, ine./ Pannanian Energy, inc.
SONATURE M oxrs __February 25, 2003
=_T==mn-_=n_ﬂ=v P
(This space lor Stale use only) \
)

g a“‘

| _
AB) NUMBER assmus+ 4’5 -2 - 3 ‘/ 9 9_9/ 9"?(,6‘5%mvm.~.

(11/20011 : (Soa Instruclang on Rgvares Bide)




T10S, RI8BE, S.L.B.&M.
1010 S89°52'E — 79.98 (G.L.0.) GASCO Energy, Inc.

Brass Cop 2631.97° (Measured)
S893748°F — 2626.92° (Meas.) NBIB2'W G.L.0. (Basis of Bearings)
& Q 0 WELL LOCATION, FEDERAL

| { o ! s #22-30-10-18, LOCATED AS SHOWN
| IN THE SE 1/4 NW 1/4 OF SECTION

30, T10S, R18E, S.L.B.&M. UINTAH
COUNTY, UTAH.

NOOO5'10"W — 2646.31° (Meas.)

30

|
WELL LOCATION:
FEDERAL #22-30-10-18 |
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THEq®3

ELEY. UNGRADED GROUND = 5441.5’ PREPARED FROM FIELD NOZF"
MADE BY ME OR UNDER 4¥

THE SAME ARE TRUE A

MY KNOWLEDGE AND

NO'OTE (G.L.0.)

-
G
-
o
o
XL
e
o
o
Z

REGI
REGISY

S89°57°E — 80.16 (G...0.)
180 NORTH VERNAL AVE. — VERNAL, UTAH 84078
(435) 781-2501

FEDERAL #22-30-10-18 SCALE: 1" = 1000' | SURVEYED BY: D.JS.
& = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED LATITUDE = 39' 55° 00.55”
BASIS OF ELEV; U.5.G.S. 7-1/2 min QUAD LONGITUDE = 109" 56° 15.92”
(CROW KNOLL)

DATE: 2-17-03

DRAWN BY: J.R.S.



" i WORKSHEE™ ‘
005 | LICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 03/03/2003 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-34924

WELL NAME: FED 22-30-10-18
OPERATOR.: PANNONIAN ENERGY INC ( N1815 )

CONTACT : LISA SMITH PHONE NUMBER: 303-857-9999

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SENW 30 1008 180E
SURFACE: 1968 FNL 2161 FWL . Tech Review Initials Date
BOTTOM: 1968 FNL 2161 FWL . .
Engineering
UINTAH
UNDESIGNATED ( 2 ) Geology
LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface
LEASE NUMBER: UTU-74408
SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal LATITUDE: 39.91673
PROPOSED FORMATION: MVRD LONGITUDE: 109.93742

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED:

V/,'Plat

‘/Bond: Fed[1l] Ind[] Stal] Feel]
(No. 4127759 )
A potash (Y/N)
!ﬂ; 0il Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13
Water Permit

LOCATION AND SITING:

R649-2-3.

Unit

\// R649-3-2., General

Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 43-1723 ) Drilli ni
rillin nit
[\l RDCC Review (Y/N) "
Board Cause No:
(Date: )
Eff Date:
ZSU& Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS :

STIPULATIONS: |- ‘Qd.w&.ﬁ &ﬁ-PrM\D
Z;- L_Q,m & (g(&h £




WELLS UNIT STATUS
#  GASINJECTION [ | ExPLORATORY
. CRSSTORAGE _ GASSTORAGE
. LOCATION ABANDONED - " /¥ OlL
NF SECONDARY
©®  NEW LOCATION i
+  PLUGGED & ABANDONED ]
*  PRODUCING GAS G
+  PRODUCING OIL PP GEOTHERML

- SHUT-IN GAS

[Jwou

+  SHUT-INOL [ seconpary
X TEMP. ABANDONED | TERMINATED
¢ TEST WELL

a WATER INJECTION
4 WATER SUPPLY
-4 WATER DISPOSAL

“Tosri7ZE |mosriee | S
DESERT
bt UTELAND
| 7.18-10-18 FeDERAL BUTT'E
| FIELD
4 f =
[
SPRINGS DEBERT et
B 5
DESERT.
| SPRING
- 18-90-10
| =t e
|
| mo, | e
7 3 ! | x
é SPRING
| 7-30-10-18 |
[ % [
DESERT |
| | i
DESERT |
‘ %815 |
\ |
R ———
o—— —— | [
| |
x | ‘
| |
. . | .
UTELAND
| BUTTE 2
&
|
|
. T | |
OPERATOR: PANNONION ENERGY INC (N1815)
SEC.30 T10S, RIBE \\a % AL
FIELD: UNDESIGNATED (002) \w
m—
COUNTY: UINTAH e, ——
e e ——
SPACING: R649-3-2 / GENERAL SITING

Utah Oil Gas and Mining

N

S

PREPARED BY: DIANA MASON
DATE: 6-MARCH-2003
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& Stat®of Utah ®

v) DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
PO Box 145801
Governor | S8l Lake City, Utah 84114-5801
Robert L. Morgan (801) §38—5340 telephone
Executive Director (801) 359-3940 fax
Lowell B Braxton (807) 538-7223 TTY
Division Director www.nr.utah.gov March 17, 2003

Michael O, Leavitt

Pannonian Energy Inc.
14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #H236
Englewood, CO 80112

Re:  Federal #22-30-10-18 Well, 1968' FNI., 2161' FWL, SE NW, Sec. 30, T. 10 South,
R. 18 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 ef seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 ef seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the cxpiration datc. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-34924.

Sincerely,

LS.

ohn R. Baza
Assoctiatc Director

mj
Enclosures
cc! Uintah County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, District Office

Ulah!

Where tdvas comnect



Operator: _ Pannonian Energy Inc. o
Well Name & Number Fedcral #22-30-10-18

API Number: 43-047-34924

Lease: UTU-74408

Location: SE NW Sec. 30 T. 10 South R. 18 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
. Contact Carol Danicls at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
. Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersedc the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an arca for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the “Board”).
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
gcological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an arca larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board cstablishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the Board.



!

FORM APPROVED

! «Form 3160-3 - , |
(August 1999) _ : OMB No. 1004-0136
. UNITED STATES [E @ E D w E n ~ Expires November 30, 2000
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR FEB ] 5. Lease Serial No.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 27 2003 UTU-74408
' - | 6. If indian, Al Tribe N
013  APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER N e
1a -Type of Work:[X] DRILL [} REENTER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Namne and No.
NA
’ 8. Lease Name and Well No.
b. Type of Well: [:l Oil Well m Gas Well D Other m Single Zone D Multiple Zone Federal #22-30-10-18
2. Name of Operator 303-483-0044 14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #4236 9. APEWell No.
GASCO Energy, Inc. ' ‘ Englewood, CO 80112 _
3. Name of Agent 303-857-9999 14421 County Road 10 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
Permitco Inc. - Agent ' Fort Lupton, CO 80621 Wildcat
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area
At surface 1968' FNL and 2161’ FWL ' - Sec. 30, TIOS-R18E
At proposed prod. zone SE NW '
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State
Approximately 29.5 miles Southeast of Myton, UT Uintah UT
15, Drstance ffom proposed™ 116. No.of Acresinlease | 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
location to l‘ll::r:e!i; ﬂ . ]
mmr?;rest dng "unit line, if amy) 1968 1720 N/A
I8. tl:‘))l::;rg% fm“:h:ggﬂﬁ,lgﬁ;ﬂ:d 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file — |
appld tor, on isl e, ] -
| None 12,500 Bond # 4127759 (4 /333
21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22, Approximate date Qork will start* 23. 'Estimated duration
5442 GL May 1, 2003 . . 35Days
24. Attachments

=D
o
o
Go
W
\
Ny

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations uniess covered by an existing bond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above). ‘
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, ! 5. Operator certification.
SUPOQ shall be filed thh the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
c o N F ' DEN ’ : authorized office.

25. Signature | Name (Printed/Typed) - iDl.lﬂ .
/kﬁu / M/ | Lisa L. Smith \  2/25/2003

Title

TN (Primied/yped) | [ Dite

iOfﬁcc JUI

[}
1 nnl

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the apphcnm holds legal or equitable title to thosc rights i in the su e easeq'rhlch would entitle the applicant to
conduct operations thereon.

Conditions of approval, if any,dare attached. ’ NOT'CE OF APPROVAL

S
Title 18 U.S.C. Section IOOIand Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfuily to riwmke 10 any depmmem or agency of the

United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or reprcsenmlons as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
o

*(Instructions on reverse)

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL ATTACHED




COAs Page 1 of 4
Well No.: Federal 22-30-10-18

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/QOperator: (asco Energy, Inc.

Well Name & Number: Federal 22-30-10-18

Lease Number: _ U-78443

API Number: 43-047-34924

Location: SENW _ Sec. 30 T.108 R.18E

Agreement: N/A

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval

for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program. : '
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable

title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations

thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well is
being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

1. DRILLING PROGRAM

Report ALL water shows and water-bearing sands to John Mayers of this office prior to setting
the next casing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies of State of Utah form
OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected, submit samples to this office
along with any water analyses conducted.




COAs Page 2 of 4
Well No.: Federal 22-30-10-18

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLM at onsite)
encountered during drilling, will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas
shows will be tested to determine commercial potential. o

2.  Pressure Control Equipment
Chart recorders shall be used for all pressure tests.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while drilling
-and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request. |

3. Casing Pr Auxili uipment

In addition to the cementing proposal for the surface casing, Class G neat cemant..shall be placed

within the surface casing-conductor annulus from the surface down to a minimum of 200’

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to this office on a weekly basis.

To evaluate cement quality across the usable water zone, a Cement Bond Log will be required
from the surface casing shoe to the base of the conductor pipe.

Ed Forsman (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435) 781-4410




r\\
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COAs Page 3 of 4
Well No.: Federal 22-30-10-18

EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPT EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, they are not necessarily hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids

Gas plant cooling tower cleaning wastes

.Painting wastes

0il and gas service company wastes, such as empty drums, drum rinsate, vacuum truck rinsate,
sandblast media, painting wastes, spend solvents, spilled chemicals, and waste acids
Vacuum truck and drum rinsate from trucks and drums, transporting or containing nonexempt
waste

Refinery wastes

Liquid and solid wastes generated by crude oil and tank bottom reclaimers

Used equipment lubrication oils

Waste cdmpressor oil, filters, and blowdown

Used hydraulic fluids

Waste solvents

Waste in transportation pipeline-related pits

Caustic or acid cleaners

Boiler cleaning wastes

Boiler refractory bricks

Incinerator ash

Laboratory wastes

Sanitary wastes

Pesticide wastes

Radioactive tracer wastes

Drums, insulation and miscellaneous solids.




COAs Page 4 of 4
Well No.: Federai 22-30-10-18

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
FOR THE SURFACE USE PROGRAM OF THE
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Prior to the construction of the access road and well location, a qualified wildlife biologist shall
monitor the golden eagle nests located adjacent to the location to determine if they are active. If
either of the nests are active, mitigating measures shall be developed for the protection of the nest.



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(this form should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: 43—047—34924 \

Weil Name: Federal #22-30-10-18 , _
Location: 1968' FNL and 2161' FWL, SE NW, Sec. 30, T108 - R18E, Uintah.County
Company Permit Issued to:. GASCO Energy, Inc./Pannonian Energy, Inc.
Date Original Permit Issued: ~ 3/17/2003 |

Theundersigned as owner with'llegal rights to drill on the property as permitted
abovq, hataby venﬂes that the mfonnation as subrmtted in the prekusly

If location on private land, has the ownem:&lchanged If 50, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesL__l N

Have any wells been drilled in- the vicinity of the proposed well which, would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this Iocatlon? Yes[[] NOIE

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the:
permitting or operation of this proposed well? Yes[_] Nolx]

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-% |
of-way, which could affect the proposed location?  Yes ] No

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? Yes[:] Nol:)ﬂ _

s 10 e siifface Tocation or dccbss rette” -
which would require a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation?  Yes[ | No[X]

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Yes(X] NOD

February 11, 2004 - RECEIVED
Date
FEB 1:3 2004

DIV, OF OlL, GAS & MINING

mith - Permitco Inc.

Title: Consultant for GASCO Energy, Inc./Pannonian Energy, Inc.




Form 3160-5 UN'lT’TATES . - ” B No. 10040135

(Septemig 2001) . DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR \ Expires January 31, 2004
. * BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. LeaseScrilNo.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-74408
0 0 7 Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned vnﬂ Use Form 3180-3 (APD) for such proposals CNIA

SUBMIT IN \TRIPLICATE - Other instructions o

i
1. Typeof Well ' e N/A

7 T
Doiwet  Mosswer O oter qm FEB 182004 | : [8 WellNameundNo.
2. Name of Operator i | | Federal #22-30-10-18
GASCO Energy, Inc./Pannonian Energy, Inc. im,« _ e ., |9 API'WellNo.
3a. Address " 3. “ﬂ-ﬁne No. (mclude area code) 43-047-34924
14 invemess Drive East, Suite H236, Englewood, CO 80112} 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footuge, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description) Wildeat
1968' FNL and 2161" FWL 11. County or Parish, State
SENW | o | | R
D5 1% £ 0 Uintah County, UT
12. CHECK. APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
Notice of Intent : O Acidize [} Deepen O Production (StartResume)  [_] Water Shut-Off
[ Alter Casing [} Fracture Treat [J Reclamation [ wel Integrity
(L] Subsequent Report [1 Casing Repair O NewConstruction  [_] Recomplete X} Oter.  Request for
_ D Change Plans ) Plugand Abandon [ Temporarily Abandon Extension of APD
[ Final Abandonment Notice O Converttolnjection  [_] Plug Back [} water Disposal - ‘ \
13. Descrbe Propoud or Comp Qpendons (durly state all pertioen dewails, including esimated starting date of any proposed work and oximate duration thereof,
gg‘.l;":h%e""“ﬁ:n&’ mﬁm ﬂmel ok vall e peskorn ; "”‘“"““"’&“’” ’“"““‘lﬁ’ &“&“&%‘f‘mﬁd ‘ﬁ“u‘i&""‘uﬁ%‘""":“’ ;“ ﬁ"‘“’l mﬁ“‘:&m‘;‘% 36'days
B i, Tn, Abbraanumeat Nomees e m‘h"’n‘u’?ﬁ e o o e e, hve pecn compleita. 404 e operamr has

determined that the site is ready for fmal inspection.)

The APD for this well was previously approved by your office and will expire on June 19 f_;11004 We are requesting that you
extend this permit for an additional 12 month period. V mOE e

MAR 0 & 2004

' 3 MINING
oy, OF Ol GAS & |

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL ATTACHED

14, I hereby certify that the fmgmng is tme and corect
Namc (Printed/Typed) Title
Lisa L. Srmth Consultant for GASCO Energy_,lnc /Pannonian Energy, Inc.
i - Date
_February 11,2004

- e e

"Conditions of appioval, if anty,
certify that the applicant holds legnl or equiteble title to those ughts in the subject lease
which would catiie the spplicant o conduct aperations thereon.

Title 18 S C. Section 1001, make it a crime for an lcnowmgly and wnllﬁxllyto make to any depammm or agency of the United States any
/ ifsphr ﬁaudulent stamments or represcntanons 8s to anyt matter thhm its Junsdlcuon




Gasco Energy, Inc dba Pannonian Energy Inc.

APD Extension
Well: Federal 22-30-10-18 : Location: SENW Sec. 30, T10S, R18E
Lease: UTU 74408
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

An extension for the referenced APD is granted with the following conditions:

1. The extension will expire June 19, 2005

2. No other extensions beyond that time frame will be granted or allowed.

If you have any other questions concerning this matter, please contact Kirk Fleetwood at (435)

781-4486.




Form9 STATE OF UTAH
~* DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES .
0 0 8 DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 8. Lease Desigrastion and Serial Number
' UTU-74408
‘ 7. Indian Allottee or Tribe Name
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, deepan existing wells, or to reenter plugged and abandoned wells. 8. Unit or Communitization Agreement
Use APPLICATION FOR Pemn-hrmmau . NA
1. Type of Well N “_\L 9. Well Name and Number
oil Gas [ other (specity) o
Waell LA wel , . Federal $22-30-10-18
2. Name of Operator 10. AP WQH'NW
GASCO Energy, inc./Pannonian Energy, inc. 4304734924
3. Address of Oparator ' 4. Telephone Number 11. Field m:m, or Wildeat
14 Inverness Drive East, Suite #H236 Englewood, CO 80112 303/483-0044 ‘Wildcat
5. Location of Well
Footage 1968‘ FNL and 2161’ FWL ' County : Uintah
0Q,Sec, T.R. M. . SE L ~Stage . Utah
PR DR NOTICE REPONT R OTHERDATA
NOTICE OF INTENT SUBSEQUENT REPORT
(Submit in Duplicate) (Submit Original Form Only)
[ Abandonment 7] New Construction [(] Avandonment ¢ . [ New Construction
[] Casing Repsic 7] PusorAter Cosig | [ Casiog Repair L7 puitor Ater Casing
[] Change of Plans [] Recompletion [C] change of Plans - [ snootor Acidize
[] convesiontoiniecion [ | ShootorAcdize - | [T] Conversion o injection [ ventorFiare
[] Fracturs Treat [] ventorFiare [] Fracture Treat "] - water Shut-Off
] Muttiple Completion [ water shut-OK ] other
[X] other Request 1 year extension of APD _
‘ Date of Work Compiation:
Approximate Data Work Will Start
. Raport results of Multiple Complations and mebm 0 different reservoirs
on WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION AND LOG form.
* Must ba accompanied by a cement verification reporL -

13. DEscmaEPRopossooncowLETEnopERAﬂmstmanymamm and give pertinent dates, ﬂwunisdtmﬂym givemmoe
locations and measured and tnue vertical deptha for all markers and zones pertinent to this work.)

GASCO Energy, Inc/Pannonian Energy, Inc. requests a one year extension of the subject APD.

| corrsaming §
! " DGM {
| iniiogP i

Consuttant for -
susco Emmy ine/Pannonian En«w. luc. m 03/05/04

(State Use Only)

. ‘ . RIL ¢ ‘- .’u”‘f"r :“:)
®%0) ' ‘ See Instructions on Reverse Side | | MAR 0 8 2004
DIV.OF G oo -




STATE OF UTAH .
£ DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OiL, GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name: lg»\gﬂgag [ 22-20-10-E

API number: "/3-0‘)‘7 24924 -
Location: L (szétb\u o ¢, Townshiy, (S Renge le(j
Company that filed original application: {V L G &i/]é’ya \/ J//l (.

Date original permit was issued: e %{6 { cd

Company that permit was Issued to: Voo cin (Zm€/<\/ e

Chack Desired Action:

Transfer pending (unapproved) Appiication for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drili on the property, hereby verifies that the information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill, remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

(| Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted, herebyveifﬁesmme
information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following Is a checklist of some Items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes | No

| i located on private land, has the ownership changed? N / / —\ -

if so, has the surface agreement been updated?

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?

Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the pennithngoroperahonofttns
proposed well?

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way, which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?

NANEANERNAN

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?

Is bonding stil in place, which covers this proposed well? Bond No. /—H%‘% U7 /a? 33 \/

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drilf that is being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill, Form 3, as appropriate, with
necessary supporting information as required.

| RECEIVED
a www e L Wongeg
Name (please _ﬂ ;
Signature pate T & / 0(-/ 'J — APR'7 7 2004
Representing (company name) /(1 %CECC/ H/ Cﬁ vl oY U Cﬁwﬂéﬁdf AN // DIV.OF OIL, GAS & MINING

The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) fo be listed as the new operator on the Application for
Pormit to Drill,

(3/2004)




T sr%wmm | R FORM9

-  DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES o .

. DIVISION OF OlL, GAS AND MINING | & LEASECRSIGNATION AN SEFSAL NUMBER:
'SUNDRY NOTICES mnnsmmon WELLS ere e

Do not use this form for propossls 1o dvill new wells, significantly mwmmmmmwu T tATor CA AN
nmwmmmnmon TO DRILL form for sitch propossls.

"1 TYPE OF WELL ‘ \ mmmmw

ouLweg.D GASWELL ] OTHER ’ seeattad\od!st
T2 NAME OF GPERATORC i Gl

3 ADDRESS OF . ‘ PHONE NUMGER: 740, FIELD AND POOL, GR WILDCAT:
114 Invemess Dr. Eastm,, Englewood srage 0 2580112 (303) 483-0044 ‘

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: . COUNTY:
QTRITR, SECTION, TOANSHIP, RANGE, MERIOWN: S STATE:
: UTAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OROTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION WPEOFACTION
M nomce oF wrent 0 Acoe [J oesren L] REPERFORATE GURRENT FORMATION
(Subrmit in Duphcads) [ avercasme ] Fracrure Trear [0 swemrox 1o Repair weiL
Approdete detm workwi st |[] CaSING REPAR [J newconstrucTion [[] Tewomamy saooN
[ crance To PREVIOUS PLANG [ orerator crance [ nemerepar
(Submit Original Form Oniy) | ‘
D CHANGE WELL STATUS _ D PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) [:] WATER SHUT-OFF
Dato of work completion: : ,
[} commencLe PRODUCNG FORMATIONS [ | RECLAMATION OF WELLSTE - W onex name change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS: Mmammm\qmmw@'
Pannonian Energy, Inc. d\angodltsnamewGaumducﬂonCmnpanyeﬁecﬁvoFabmalym 2004

NI3IS
ALM Bond = UT/A33
SITLA Bond = 42776

RECEIVED
APR 22 200
DIV. OF OlL, GAS & MINING

(5r2000) (Gon inswuciions on Reverse Side)




Division of-0il, Gas and Mining

_ ROUTING

'OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH
oo 2. CDW

009 3. FILE

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: o . 2/24/2004
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
IN1815-Pannonian Energy, Inc. IN2575-Gasco Production Company
114 Inverness Dr E 114 Invemess Dr E
Englewood, CO 80112 Englewood, CO 80112
Phone: 1-(303) 483-0044 Phone: 1303) 483-0044
CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG|API NO ENTITY |[LEASE |WELL |WELL
NO TYPE TYPE | STATUS

K [GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 1108 [150E ]4301332391 |+ 13787|State GW DRL
IL GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 1108 |[150E |4301332475 State GW APD
K IWILKIN RIDGE STATE 12-32-10-17 32 11008 |170E 4301332447 |/ 14033|State GW DRL
\-|STATE 24-16-9-19 16 |090S |190E |4304735588 State GW NEW
o |[FED 23-21-9-19 210908 |190E |4304734199 | & 13601|Federal _|GW P
i |FED 11-21-9-19 21 [0908 |190E [4304734608 Federal |GW APD
¢ |[FED 42-21-9-19 21 ]090S |190E [4304735405 Federal |GW APD
¥-{FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 |0908S |190E [4304735606 Federal |GW APD
. ILYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 |090S |190E [4304734607 |/ 13640|Federal _ |GW p
{¢|FED 11-22-9-19 22 10908 |190E [4304735404 , Federal  |GW APD
v {FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 10908 |190E [4304734111 ¥ 13441|Federal GW P
s |[FED 42-29-9-19 29 |090S |190E |4304734202 |,/ 13455|Federal {GW P
‘L FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 |090S |190E |4304735343 Federal GW APD C
¢ |FED 32-31-9-19 31 |090S |190E |4304734201 |,/ 13641|Federal |GW P
¢« [FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 0908 [190E ]4304735623 Federal |GW NEW C
i [FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 0908 J190E |4304735624 Federal  |GW APD C
l{ FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 06 1100S |190E |4304734813 Federal |GW LA C
iAFED 22-30-10-18 30 ]100S [180F |4304734924 Federal  |GW APD C
¢ [LAFKAS FED 1-3 03 [1108 [200E [4304731178 |/ 1367|Federal  |GW S
» {WILLOW CREEK UNIT 2 05 |110S |200E |4304731818 |,/ 11604|Federal |GW TA
» {HILL FEDERAL 1-10 10 1108 [200E [4304731026 |,/ 1368|Federal GW TA

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

Enter date after each listed item is completed

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: ~ 4/22/2004

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/22/2004

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 4/21/2004

*kk

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number:

*hek

5. IfNO, the operator was contacted contacted on; 4/21/2004

Gasco Prod Pannonian FORM 4B.xls 4/29/2004



. ‘ i

6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on; IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM inprocess BIA

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: in process

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/29/2004
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/29/2004
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A
4. TFee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: n/a
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 4/22/2004

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 4127764

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 4127759

INDIAN WELL/(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 4127765

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:

1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number n/a
2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A

COMMENTS:

This is a corporate name change within the same corporation and it's subsidiaries

Gasco Prod Pannonian FORM 4B.xls 4/29/2004
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° o | .
United States Department‘ of the gterior | m

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEN[ENT ' TAKE PRIDE"
Utah State Office INAMERICA
~ P.O.Box 45155 B .
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov

IN REPLY REFER TO:

3106 ‘ ‘
(UT-924) , : L
May 18, 2004
Memorandum |
To: - | - Vernal Field Office, Moab Field Office
From: Chief, Branch of Minerals Adjlidication
Subject: ‘Name Change Approval

Attached is an approved copy of the name change recognized by the Utah State Office. We have
updated our records to reflect the name change from Pannoman Energy Inc., into Gasco
Production Company is effective February 24, 2004.

{s/ Robert Logpez

_ Robert Lopez
' : Chief Branch of
' Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. State of Utah Certificate of Registration

cc:  MMS, Reference Data Branch, James Sykes, PO Box 25165, Denver CO 80225 _
State of Utah, DOGM, Attn: Earlene Russell, PO Box 145801, SLC UT 84114 merpiED
RECEINVEL
Teresa Thompson

~ Joe Incardine , I o _' | MAY 20 2004

Connie Seare .
. DIV. OF OiL. GAR®

Nordstrom:05/1 8/2004
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The First Sia-te

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF
DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE' AND “C'OﬁRECT |
COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "PANNONIAN ENERGY INC.",
CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "PANNONIAN ENERGY INC." TO "GASCO |
PRODUCTION COMPANY", FILED IN THI.:: OFFICE ON THE TWENTY-FOURTH
DAY OF FEEBRUARY, A.D. 2004, AT 12:43 O'CLOCK P.M.

A FILED COPY OF THIS CERTIFICATE HAS BEEN FORWARDED TO THE
NEW CASTLE COUNTY RECORDER OF DEEDS.

Lornict sbmiss P

. Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

2899291 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 2963993

040133641 | .~ DATE: 03-02-04
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03576
01562B
0125822
013429A
013766
013820

013821A .-

0147541

01475144
016869A

017713
017991
018260A
035316
058148

3344
8346
8648

28212
34350
37246
39223
44089
44090A
60748A
60748X
62159
64921
65319
65323
65324
65767
65773
65776
65779
65782
65783
65785
66798
66800
67253
68387
68620
69003
69094
69095

69096
70847
70848
70849
70850
70887
70888
70889
71401
72013
73165
73425

73664 .
73666

73669
74387
74395
74396
74397
74401
74403
74407
74968
74971
75079
75088

75231 .

75233
75232

75235

75236
75514

75515
75670

75672
76031
76032
76033
76034
76057
76256
76262
76478
76489

76490

76760
76761
76809

76810

76811 -

76812
76814
76818
77063
77336
78214
78215
78216
78433

79784

80593
80679



Gasco Production

api twsp {rng |sec |well_name lease_num stat |la_pa
4304734168 |090S |190E |20 |FED 24-20-9-19 UTU-75090 |DRL
4304734169 |090S [190E |20 |FED 44-20-9-19 UTU-75090 DRL
4304734199 |090S [190E |21  |FED 23-21-9-19 UTU-78433 |P
4304734608 |090S |190E |21 |FED 11-21-9-19 UTU-78433 |DRL
4304735405  |090S |190E |21 |FED 42-21-9-19 ) UTU-78433 |APD
4304735606 |090S {190E |21 FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 UTU-78433 APD |
4304734607 |090S |190E |22 |LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 UTU-78433 [P
4304735404 |090S |190E |22 |FED 11-22.9-19 UTU-78433 DRL
4304733653 |090S |[190E |29 |FEDERAL 31-29 UTU-76262
4304733750 |090S [190E |29 |FEDERAL 34-29 UTU-76034
4304734111 |090S |190E |29 |FEDERAL 23-29 #1 UTU-76262 B
4304734202  |090S [190E |29 |FED 42-29-9-19 UTU-76262
4304735343  |090S [190E |30 |FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 UTU-37246  |DRL
4304734201 0905 |190E |31 FED 32-31-9-19 UTU-76489 P
4304735623 |090S [190E {31 |FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 UTU-019880A |APD
4304735624 |090S |190E |31 FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 UTU-019880A |APD
4304734286 |100S |170E [12 |PETES WASH 23-12 #1 UTU-77063 |P
4301332560 [100S |[170E {17 |WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 |UTU-043615 |APD
4304734551 1008 |170E |24 |FED 43-24-3 #1 UTU-74401 P
4304733983 |100S |180E |07 |FEDERAL 24-7 #1 UTU-68387 P
4304734539 |100S [180E (18 |FED 14-18-2 #1 UTU-74971  |P
4304735808 |100S |180E |22 |FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 UTU-018260A |APD
4304734924 |100S |180E |30 [FED 22-30-10-18 UTU-74408 |APD
4304734813 |100S |190E |06  |FED 21-6-10-19 UTU-76490  [LA | 3/30/2004
4304731178 [1108 |200E |03 |LAFKAS FED 1-3 U-34350 5
4304731818 1105 |200E |05 |WILLOW CREEK UNIT 2 U-39223 TA
4304731026 {110S |200E {10 |HILL FEDERAL 1-10 U-44089 TA

7/1/2004
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DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

Name of Company: GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

Well Name: FEDERAL 22-30-10-18

Api No: 43-047-34924 Lease Type: FEDERAL

Section_30  Township__10S  Range 18E _ County UINTAH

Drilling Contractor NABORS RIG #__ 924
SPUDDED:

Date 08/05/04

Time 12:00 NOON

How DRY

Drilling will commence:

Reported by CRAIG OVERMILLER

Telephone # 1-435-828-7151

Date 08/05/2004 Signed CHD
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@GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

4 3~097- 34734
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: Cement 13 3/8" Conductor Pipe |Date: 8/7/2004 |Days 0
Depth: 220' |Prog: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation:
DMC: $0 TMC: TDC: $5,345 |CWC:
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: I# 1 6.5X10 [Bit#: Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: Size: Separator: $ Rig Move: $ -
fpvryp: |« 2 6.5X11 [Type: jint. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ -
Gel: SPM: MFG: IProd Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ -
WL: GPM : SIN: IFloat Equp: $ Trucking: 3 -
Cake: Press: Jots: Woell Head: $ Water: $ -
Solids: AV DC: lin: TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
Sand: AV DP: Out: Packers: $ Mud Logger: $ -
PH : JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
PfIMf: ECD IHrs: Separator: $ Cement: 13 3/8" $ 5345
Chlor: SPR# : FPH: |Heater: $ Bits: $ -
Ca : SPR #2 : JWOB: IPumping uT: § Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: |Btm.Up: IRPM: IPrime Mover: $ Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ -
START END TIME |Rot. Hrs: IDaily Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ -
Misc. / Labor: $ -
Obermiller air drilled 17 1/2" hole to 220' 8-6-04. Csg. Crew: $ -
Ran 5 jts. 13 3/8", 48 ppf, K-55, ST&C, 8 Rd, New Csg = 219", Daily Total: $ 5345
Set @ 218" Cum, Wtr:
Cum. Fuel
8-7-04. Big 4 Cementing Co. cemented 13 3/8" casing w/225 sx. Cum, Bits:
CI-G cement cont'g. 2% CaCl and 1/4 pps flocele, mixed @ 15.8 BHA
ppg. Had good returns thru'out. Displaced cement w/30 BFW.
Circulated 11 bbls. cement to reserve pit. Cement stayed at
ground level after 30 mins. Did not have to top off cement.
JC @ 1130 hrs. 8-7-04. Did not use top plug. Closed 2" valve
on casing swage. WOC 8 hrs.
TOTAL BHA =
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
810 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man Ron Turell PEAK GAS
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 6

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Gasco Production Company

I

Operator Account Numbél“.f'l\f A T

Operator:
Address: 14 Inverness Dr. East, Suite H-236
city Englewood
state CO zip 80112 Phone Number: (303) 483-0044
well 1
API Number.. "} - #i] Sec | Twp | Rng County
4304734924 Federal 22-30-10-18 30 108 18E Uintah
Action Code Current Entity . AS
Number - H JEf
A 8/5/2004 g /5 | /pef
Comments: - . ! 7
Uk OWFIDENTIAL

Do 2 e o A
5

Well Name QQ - |uSee: &
' _Current Entu% B ment:
<Number. %ﬁffective Date

Comments:

Well 3

i . Twp.\:‘

i County:

Current Entity
Number

New Entity .
Number = '

Comments:

ACTION CODES:

A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only)

moOQw

(5/2000)

« Add new well to existing entity (group or unit well)
- Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity
- Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
Other (Explain in ‘comments’ section)

Mari A. Johnson

CFoes N T
/ { ——

Signature — L
Manager of Property Admin 8/19/2004
Title Date



RECFIVED
SEP Z 1 2004

Division of Qil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attn: Carol Daniels
September 19, 2004

Dear Ms Daniels:

Gasco Production Company (Pannonian Energy) will soon be drilling the Federal 22-30-
10-18, SENW 30-10S-18E, Uintah County, Utah. The API Number for this well is 43-
047-34924.

Gasco recently reached total depth at the Desert Spring State 7-36A, SWNE 36-9S-18E,
Uintah County, Utah. The API Number for this well is 43-047-33741.

Gasco wishes to keep all information on these wells CONFIDENTIAL for as long a
period as possible.

Yours truly,
(b bea
Robin Dean

Senior Geologist
Gasco Energy, Inc.

GASCUEnmg%lnc
14 Inverness Drive East, Suite H-236 Tel: {303) 483-0044 Email:  invest@gascoenergy.com

Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: (303) 483-0011 Website: www.gascoenergy.com

OTCBB: GASE
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Y3-049-39747 DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT e PV
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: REPAIR PUMP CLUTCH Date: 9/25/2004 |Days: 0
Depth: 800'  |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation:
DMC: $0 TMC: $0 TDC: $65,352 JCWC: $70,697
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: I# 1 6.5X10 |Bit #: JConductor: $ - |Lo¢,Cost: $ -
VIS: SPM: lSIze: Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
Ipvivp: 2 6.5X11 [Type: Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 28,050
IGeI: ISPM: [MFG: IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,000
IWL: IGPM : ISIN: IFIoat Equp: $ = |Trucking: $ 1720
ICake: IPress: Jeots: IWell Head: $ - |water: $ 15704
ISolids: AV DC: Iin: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ 10,878
ISand: AV DP: Out: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : JetVel: JFTG: Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: JECD IHrs: iSeparator: $ - |Cement: 13 3/8" $ 5345
IChlor: SPR#1 : IFPH: IHeatar: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : SPR #2 : IWOB: IPumping LUT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
[Dapp ppb: |Btm.Up: IRPM: IPrime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ -
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - [Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME jRot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ -
Misc. / Labor: $ 1830
Csg. Crow: $ -
Daily Total: $ 65,352
Cum. Witr: $ 15,704
Cum. Fuel $ 10,878
Cum. Bits:
BHA
TOTAL BHA =
Survey
Survey
PIU LITH: BKG GAS
S/10 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS




19
+ jo5 R ISE s @'% Gascoeneray @

Fl

43 ~0Y0~ 3 4?0791 DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT  L.{ jii” i {_j [H ] L
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: PICK UP BHA Date: 9/26/2004 |Days: 0
Depth: 800 Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation:
DMC: TMC:- TDC: $26,315 JCWC: $97,012
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
fmw: I# 1 6.5X10 |Bit#; Jconductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
vIS: ISPM: lSize: Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
Ipvryp: #2 6.5X11 |Type: Jint. Csg: $ - iDay Rate: $ 11,000
Gel: SPM: IMFG: IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1900
fwL: GPM : ISIN: IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: Jots: IWe»ll Head: $ - |water: $ -
Isolids: AV DC: Iin: TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuek $ -
ISand: AV DP: Out: Packers: $ -+ |Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : JetVel: |FTG: Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: |ECD IHrs: : {Separator: $ - |Cement: 13 3/8" $ -
IChIor: ISPR #1: IFPH: IHoater: $ - |Bits: $ 10,000
Ca : ISPR #2: 'WOB: IPumping L/T: $ = IMud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: IBtm.Up: IRPM: Prime Mover: $ - [Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: IDaily Total: $ - | Drilling Mud: $ -
6:00 20:00 14:00 |JREPAIR PUMP CLUTCH Misc. / Labor: $ -
20:00 6:00 10:00 |PICK UP BHA Csg. Crew: $ -
Daily Total: $ 26,315
Cum. Wtr: $ 15704
JCum. Fuel $ 10878
Cum. Bits: $ 10,000
BHA
TOTALBHA =
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Y304 7- 2Y97Y
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 9/27/2004 Days: 1
Depth: 1408' [Prog: 608 |D Hrs: 13 AV ROP: 46 Formation: Surface
DMC: $1,592 TMC: $1,592 TDC: $20,958 JCWC: $117,970
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: W I# 1 6.5X10 |Bit#: 1 JConductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: A ISPM: 71 ISize: 12 1/4" ISurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: T I# 2 | 6.5X11 |Type: 8X318 Ilnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,000
Gel: E ISPM: 64  |MFG: SEC. IProd Csg: 3 - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
fwi: R IGPM : 581 |sm: 10664011 lFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
ICako: IPress: 1700  fJets: 3-18 Woll Head: $ - jwater: $ 545
Solids: AV DC: iln: 800 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: AV DP: IOut: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : JetVel: IFTG: 608 Tanks: $ - __|Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: Jeco IHrs: 13 |Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior: ISPR #1: IFPH: 46 IHoater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : SPR #2 ; IWOB: 35/45 IPumplng ut: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: IBtm.Up: IRPM: 507100 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/B/G: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ - |[Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: lDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,592
6:00 16:00 10:00 JRIG REPAIR WORK ON PUMPS & CHANGE SWIVEL PACKING Misc. [ Labor: $ 2506
16:00 16:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crow: $ -
16:30 20:00 3:30 |DRLG. F/800' T/1000" 200" 57 fph Daily Total: $ 20,958
20:00 20:30 0:30 JSURVEY @ 950" 1 Deg. jcum. wir: $ 16,249
20:30 6:00 9:30 |DRLG. F/1000' T/11408' 408' 42 fph Cum. Fus! $ 10878
[Cum. Bits: $ 10,000
BHA
IMud Motor 8" 1.00
INRS 12 114" 26.09
Shock Sub a" 8.02
1-D.C. 8" 12.00
INRS 12 1/4" 26.60
1-D.C. 8" 7.50
JC/O 6 1/4" 2.90
24 -D.C. 6 1/4" 720.07
TOTAL BHA = 804.18
Survey 1 950'
Survey
P/IU LITH: BKG GAS
$/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

i

VT LR e

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 9/28/2004 Days: 2
Depth: 2412' |Prog: 1004 [D Hrs: 22 1/2 |AV ROP: 44.6 Formation: Surface
DMC: $526 TMC: $2,118 TDC: $20,464 JCWC: $138,434
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: w I# 1 6.5X11 IBit#: 1 conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
vis: A ISPM: 71 |size: 12 1/4" lsm. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
lpvrve: T l# 2 6.5X10 {Type: SX315 lint. Csg: 3 - |Day Rate: $ 11,000
Gel: E ISPM: 85 |mFG: SEC. IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
jwL: R IGPM : 668 Ism: 10664011 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 675
ICake: IPross: 1700 [Jets: 3-18 IWell Head: $ - |water: $ -
ISolids: AV DC: 126 Jin: 800 TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuel: $ -
ISand: AV DP: 113 JOut: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : JetVel: 287 |FTG: 1612 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
[PfIMf: feco 8.5 IHrs: 351/2 1Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
IChlor: SPR #1: IFPH: 454 Heator: $ - |Bits: 3 -
ICa : [SPR#2: IWOB: 35/45 IPumplng L. $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: IBtm.Up: 15 IRPM: 50/ 100 IPrime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 lMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: lDally Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 526
6:00 7:30 1:30 JDRLG. F/1408' T/1501' 83' 62 fph Misc. / Labor: $ 2,948
730 | 800 | 0:30 |SURVEY @ 1451 3/4 Deg. fcsg. crew: s .
8:00 9:30 1:30 IDRLG. F/1501' T/1564' 63' 42 fph Daily Total: $ 20464
9:30 10:00 0:30 IRIG SEVICE Cum. Wtr: $ 16,249
10:00 21:30 11:30 JDRLG. F/1564' T/2067' 503" 43.7 fph Cum. Fuel $ 10878
21:30 22:00 0:30 JSURVEY @ 2017 3/4 Deg. Cum. Bits: $ 10,000
22:00 6:00 8:00 JDRLG. F/2067' T/2412' 345' 43.1 fph BHA
IMud Motor 8" 1.00
INRS 12 1/4" 26.09
IShock Sub 8" 8.02
1-D.C. 8" 12.00
INRS 12 114" 26.60
1-D.C. 8" 7.50
1C/IO0 ' 61/4" 2.90
24-D.C. 6 1/4" 720.07
TOTAL BHA = 804.18
Survey 3/4 1451
Survey 3/4 2017
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 0 TRIP GAS
FUEL  Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

‘/3—aw'~39f7g,4

i
i

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date:  9/29/2004 Days: 3
Depth: 3112° |Prog: 700 |DHrs: 21 IAV ROP: 33.3 Formation: Surface
DMC: $2,138 TMC: $4,256 TDC: $21,242 JCWC: $159,676
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
MW: w I# 1eem  6.5X11 |BIt#: 1 |Conductor: § = |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: A SPM: 71 Size: 12 1/4" ISurf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
Ipvivp: T J#240m  6.5X10 [Type: SX318 llnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,000
Gel: E ISPM: 85 IMFG: SEC. lProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
fwL: R IGPM : 668 |SIN: 10664011 IFIoat Equp: $ 2,264 |Trucking: $ 525
ICake: 'Press: 1700  |Jots: 3-18 IWell Head: $ - |water: $ -
ISoIids: AV DC: 126 [in: 800 TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel: $ -
ISand: AV DP: 113 IOut: |Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : JetVel: 287 IFTG: 2312 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: Jecp 8.5 [Hrs: 56 1/2 Jseparator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChIor: SPR #1 : IFPH: 40.9 [Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : SPR#2 : IWOB: 35/45 lPumplng uT:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: |Btm.Up: 23 IRPM: 507100 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:} 56 1/2 IDain Total: $ 2,264 |Drilting Mud: $ 2138
6:00 9:00 3:00 [DRLG. F/2412' T/2538' 126" 42 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:00 9:30 0:30 JSURVEY @ 2488 2 Deg. Csg. Crew: $ -
9:30 16:00 6:30 |DRLG. F/2538' T/2789' 251' 38.6 fph Daily Total: $ 18,978
16:00 17:00 1:00 |SURVEY @ 2739" 2 Deg. & RIG SERVICE Cum. Wtr: $ 16,249
17:00 21:00 4:00 |DRLG. F/2789' 7/2924' 135" 33.8 fph Curn. Fuel $ 10,878
21:00 22:00 1:00 JRIG REPAIR ( LIGHT PLANT ) Curmn. Bits: $ 10,000
22:00 1:00 3:00 JDRLG. F/2924' T/3006' 82' 27.3 fph BHA
1:00 1:30 0:30 JSURVEY @ 2956 1 1/4 Deg. [Mud Motor 8" 1.00
1:30 6:00 4:30 |DRLG. F/3006' T/3112' 106' 23.6 INRS 12 114" 26.09
Shock Sub 8" 8.02
1-D.C. 8" 12.00
INRS 12 1/4" 26.60
1-D.C. 8" 7.50
cio 6 1/4" 2.90
24-D.C. 6 114" 720.07
TOTAL BHA = 804.18
Survey 2 2488
Survey 11/4 2956'
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
§/0 0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 0 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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T l()c lj DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT
pes N ivy
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: TRIP FOR B{T Date: 9/30/2004 Days: 4
Depth: 3310' _|Prog: 198 |D Hrs: 20 AV ROP: 9.9 Formation: Surface
DMC: $1,627 TMC: $5,883 TDC: $38,747 JCWC: $198,423
Contractor: Nabors # 924 IMud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
mw: w I# 1asgpm  6.5X11 IBit # 1 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: A ISPM: 71 Sizo: 12 1/4" |surt. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
Ipviyp: T I# 24100m  6.5X10 [Type: SX 318 Ilnt. Csg: $ « __|Day Rate: $ 11,000
IGoI: E SPM: 85 |mFG: SEC. IProd Csg: $ - [Rental Tools: $ 1,800
IWL: R GPM : 668 |SIN: 10664011 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
ICako: JPress: 1700  |Jets: 3-18 Well Head: $ - |Water: $ 20,805
Solids: AV DC: 126 Jin: 800 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuek $ -
Jsand: AV DP: 113 |Out: 3310 JPackers: 5 - |Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : JotVel: 287 |FTG: 2510 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: Jecp 8.5 IHrs: 76 1/2 Iseparator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChlor: SPR #1 : IFPH: 32.8 IHoator: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : |SPR#2: IWOB: 35/45 IPumping utT: % - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
lDapp ppb: IBtm.Up: 27 IRPM: 507100 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1627
6:00 11:00 5:00 JDRLG. F/3112' T/3163' 51' 5.1 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
11:00 11:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE ICs;_;. Crew: $ -
11:30 2:30 15:00 |DRLG. F/3163' T/3310' 147" 9.8 fph Daily Total: $ 38,747
2:30 6:00 3:30_JTRIP OUT FOR BIT JCum. Wtr: $ 37,054
Cum. Fuel $ 10,878
{Cum. Bits: $ 10,000
BHA
IMud Motor 8" 1.00
INRS 12 1/4" 26.09
Shock Sub 8" 8.02
1-D.C. 8" 12.00
INRS 12 1/4" 26.60
1-D.C. 8" 7.50
Jcio 61/4" 2.90
24-D.C. 6 1/4" 720.07
TOTAL BHA = 804.18
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 10/1/2004 Days: 5
Depth: 3441' |Prog: 131 __|DHrs:  111/2 |AV ROP: 11.4 Formation: Surface
DMC: $486 TMC: $6,369 TDC: $134,801 JCWC: $333,224
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
IMw: w l# fasem  6.5X11 |Bit#: 1 2RR |Conductor: $ - {Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: A ISPM: 71 ISize: 12 1/4" 12 1/4" |Surf. Csg: $ - IRig Move: $ 118,000
IPvIYP: T I# 2a1m  6,5X10 [Type: SX318 HP 53 A |int. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,000
IGGI: E ISPM: 85 |MFG: SEC. REED IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1900
IWL: R IGPM : 668 |SIN: 10664011 | KA 4512 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
ICake: IPms: 1700 Lets: 3-18 18-Mar |Woell Head: $ - |water: $ -
ISoIids: AV DC: 126 [in: 800 3310  ITBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
ISand: AV DP: 113 IOut: 3310 IPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ -
ey JetVel: 267 |Fre: 2510 131 [Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: JECD : 85 IHrs: 76 1/2 11 1/2  jSeparator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChIor: ISPR # IFPH: 32.8 11.4  |Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : lSPR #2: IWOB: 35/45 30/40 IPumping LT $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: IBtm.Up: 32 RPM: 507100 50/100 IPrlrne Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: e 5/F/1" lMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
sTART | Enp | mime |Rot. Hrs: 88 IpaiyTota:  $ - |Drilling Mua: $ 486
6:00 8:00 2:00 |TRIP OUT FORBIT #2 Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:00 8:30 0:30 JCHANGE BIT Csg. Crew: $ -
8:30 11:30 3:00 |TRIP IN HOLE TO 3100' Daily Total: $ 134,801
11:30 13:30 2:00 JWASH & REAM F/3100' T/3163' JCum. wir: $ 37,054
13:30 | 1400 | 030 Jric service lcum. Fuel $ 10,878
1400 | 1530 | 1:30 |RIG REPAIR ( PACK SWIVEL ) lcum. Bits: $ 10,000
15:30 18:00 2:30 JWASH & REAM UNDER GAUGE HOLE F/3163' T/3310' BHA
18:00 20:30 2:30 JDRLG. F/3310' T/33563' 43' 17.2 fph IMud Motor 8" 1.00
20:30 21:00 0:30 JSURVEY @ 3303' 2 1/4 Deg. INRS 12 1/4" 26.09
21:00 6:00 9:00 IDRLG. F/3363' T/3441' 88' 9.8 fph Shock Sub 8" 8.02
1-D.C. 8" 12.00
INRS 12 1/4" 26.60
1-D.C. 8" 7.50
fcio 6 1/4" 2.90
24-D.C. 6 1/4" 720.07
TOTAL BHA = 804.18
Survey 21/4 3303'
Survey
P/U 130 LITH: BKG GAS
S/I0 130 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 130 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT el

4 3-04 9. 3Y74Y

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: CMT. 8 5/8" SURFACE CSG. Date: 10/2/2004 Days: 6
Depth: 3465 |Prog: 24 D Hrs: 41/2 |AV ROP: 5.3 Formation: Surface
DMC: $1,734 TMC: $8,103 TDC: $97,508 JCWC: $430,732
Contractor: Nabors # 924 IMud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: W I# 1asgpm  6.5X11 IBit #: 2 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: A ISPM: 71 Size: 12 1/4" JSurf. Csg: $ 61,500 |Rig Move: $ -
|PVIYP: T I# 2a1gem  6.5X10 [Type: HP 63 A Ilnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: E ISPM: 85 |MFG: REED IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: R IGPM : 668 |SIN: KA 4512 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 525
|cake: IPress: 1700  JJets: 18-Mar Waell Head: $ 3,515 |water: $§ 3515
ISoIids: AV DC: 126 jin: 3310 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: AV DP: 113 IOut: 3465 Packers: $ - |[Mud Logger: $ -
JPH : JetVel: 287 IFTG: 155 Tanks: $ - __|Logging: $ -
leIMf: JECD 8.5 IHrs: 16 Iseparator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChIor: ISPR #: IFPH: 9.7 IHeator: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : SPR#2: IWOB: 30/40 IPumping ur: % - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
lDapp ppb: [Btm.Up: 33 IRPM: 507100 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 4/E1112 IMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME Jrot. Hrs: 93 IDain Total: $ 65,015 |Drilling Mud: $ 1,734
6:00 10:30 4:30 |DRLG. F/3441' T/3465' 24' 5.3 fph Misc. / Labor: $ 2510
10:30 11:30 1:00 JCIRC. & COND. FOR SHORT TRIP Csg. Crow: $ 7,394
11:30 13:00 | 1:30 |SHORT TRIP 10 STDS. - NO TIGHT HOLE Daily Total: $ 32,493
13:00 14:00 1:00 JCIRC. & COND. HOLE FOR 8 5/8" CSG. Cum. Wir: $ 37,054
14:00 14:30 0:30 JPUMP PILL & DROP SURVEY Cum. Fuel $ 10,878
14:30 19:00 4:30 JTRIP OUT & LAY DOWN 8" TOOLS (SLM NO CORR)) Cum. Bits: $ 10,000
19:00 X X JRIG UP T&M CASERS & RAN 83 JTS. 8 5/8" 32# J-55 WITH BHA
X 1:30 6:30 JFLOAT SHOE & COLLAR - TOTAL 3457.25' [Mud Motor 8" 1.00
1:30 4:00 2:30 JRIG UP SCHLUMBERGER & CIRC. & COND. FOR CMT. INRS 12 114" 26.09
4:00 6:00 2:00 JCMT. 8 5/8" Shock Sub 8" 8.02
1-D.C. 8" 12.00
INRS 12 1/4" 26.60
1-D.C. 8" 7.50
IC/IO 6 1/4" 2.90
24 -D.C. 6 1/4" 720.07
TOTAL BHA = 804.18
Survey 2172 3416’
Survey
PIU 130 LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 130 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 130 LAST CSG.RAN 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: PRESSURE TEST BOPs Date: 10/3/2004 Days: 7
Depth: 3465' IProg: 0 DHrs: 0 IAV ROP: 0 Formation: Surface
DMC: $0 TMC: $8,103 TDC: $61,629 JCWC: $492,361
|Contractor: Nabors # 924 IMud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Illw: W I# 1asom  6.5X11 IBIt #: jconductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: A lSPM: Sizo: Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
IPVIYP: T #20100m  6.5X10 [Type: Jint. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ 11,500
lcor: E SPM: |vFe: IProd Csy: $ Rental Tools: $ 1,800
WL: R GPM : ISIN: IFIoat Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
cake: |Press: Jets: IWell Head: $ Water: $ -
ISollds: AV DC: Iin: TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
ISand: AV DP: IOut: |Packers: 3 Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : JetVel: IFTG: Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: |JECD : IHrs: Separator: $ Cement: $ 44814
IChIor: ISPR #1: IFPH: JHeater: $ Bits: $ -
|Ca : ISPR #2 IWOB: IPumplng ut: $ Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: IBtm.Up: IRPM: Prime Mover: $ Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: eG: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 93 IDaIIy Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ -
6:00 X X JCMT. WITH SCHLUMBERGER PUMPED 20 B WATER AHEAD Misc. / Labor: $ -
X X X _|OF LEAD - 610 Sk Hi-Lift WT.11 ppg YIELD 3.91 = 425B - TAIL ICSQ. Crew: $ -
X X X |260 Sk "G"WT.14.2 ppg YIELD 1.63=75B - DROP PLUG & Daily Total: $ 61,629
X X X JDISP. WITH 215 B WATER - PLUG BUMPED - FLOATS HELD JCum. Wtr: $ 37,054
X 9:00 3:00 60 B CMT TO SURF. BUT FELL BACK ICum. Fuel $ 10,878
9:00 12:.00 3:00 |BACK OUT LANDING JT. & NIPPLE DOWN |Cum. Bits: $ 10,000
12:00 13:30 1:30 JTOP OUTSIDE WITH 200 Sk "G" CMT. HOLE STAYED FULL BHA
13:30 22:30 9:00 INIPPLE UP BOPs 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
22:30 X X JPRESSURE TEST BOPs , CHOKE , VALVES & LINES T/5000 psi  {Mud Motor 6 1/4"
X 6:00 7:30 JHYDRIL T/2500psi 7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4"
Shock Sub 6 1/4"
1-61/4"DC | 6 1/4"
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4"
23-61/4"DC) 6 1/4"
TOTAL BHA =
Survey
Survey
fP/U 0 LITH: BKG GAS
S5/0 0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 0 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455’ TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG Date: 10/4/2004 Days: 8
Depth: 3800" |Prog: 335 [DHrs: 12 AV ROP: 27.9 Formation: Surface
DMC: $143 TMC: $8,246 TDC: $19,548 JCWC: $511,909
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co; M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Jmw: w I# 14spm  6.5X11 [Bit#: 3 JConductor: $ - [Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: A SPM: Size: 778" ISurf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
Ipviyp: T #2410 6.5X10 |Type: DP 506 Z llnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
IGaI: E SPM: 105  |MFG: HC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
IWL: R GPM : 430 ISIN: 7105475 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
ICake: JProsas: 1050 Rets: 6X 16 IW¢a|| Head: $ - |Water: $ -
ISolids: AV DC: 320 [in: 3465 TBG/Rods: $ - {Fuel $ -
ISand: AV DP: 215 IOut: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : JetVel: 287 IFTG: 335 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfle: JecD : 8.5 IHrs: 12 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChlor: ISPR #1: lFPH: 27.9 JHeator: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : ISPR #2: lWOB: 10/15 IPumpIng ur: § - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
IDapp pph: IBtm.Up: lRPM: 60/56 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 20
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMiac: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
sTART | Enp | mime | Jrot. vrs: 105 |paiyTota:  $ - |oritting Mud: $ 143
6:00 X PRESSURE TEST BOPs , CHOKE , VALVES & LINES T/5000 psi  Misc. / Labor: $ 1,890
X 7:30 1:30 JHYDRIL T/2500psi Csg. Crow: $ -
7:30 12:00 4:30 |INSTALL WEAR BUSHING & HOOK UP FLOW LINE Daily Total: $ 19,548
12:00 16:30 4.30 JPICK UP BHA & TRIP IN HOLE - TAG PLUG @ 3408’ JCum. wir: $ 37,054
16:30 18:00 1:30 JDRILL FLOAT, CMT. & SHOE TO 3465' Cum. Fuel $ 10,878
18:00 6:00 12:00 IDRLG. F/3465' T/3800' 335" 27.9 fph jCum. Bits: $ 10,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
IMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" I1BS 6 1/4" 5.14
JShock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
23-61/4"DCY 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey
Survey
P/U 120 LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 120 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 120 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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Y3-090-399574
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date:  10/5/2004 Days: 9
Depth: 4600' IProg: 800 |[DHrs: 221/2 |AV ROP: 35.6 Formation: Uintah
DMC: $2,825 TMC: $11,071 TDC: $21,522 JCWC: $533,431
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
IMw: 8.4 I# Tasem  6.5X11 |Bit#: 3 [Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 ISPM: Size: 77/8" ISurf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
lpvivp: il I# 2apm  6.5X10 [Type: DP 506 Z llnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
rGel: in ISPM: 105 |MFG: HC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,900
IWL: N/C GPM : 430  |sIN: 7105475 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 675
ICake: Press: 1050  |Jets: 6X16 IWell Head: $ - |water $ 507
ISOIids: 1 AV DC: 320  jin: 3465 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: 3 -
ISand: AV DP; 215 IOut: fPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9.5 JatVel: 287 IFTG: 1135 Tanks: $ - __|Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 943 Jecp : 8.5 lHrs: 34.5 |Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChIor: 12000 |SPR#1: 425 @ 60 - 32.9 IHeater: $ - |sits: $ -
ICa : 120 SPR#2: 300 @ 57 JWOB: 10/15 IPumplng LT $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: [Btm.up: 16 |RPM: 60/56 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion; $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 127.5 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $§ 2825
6:00 9:30 3:30 |DRLG. F/3800' T/3986' 186' 53.1 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:30 10:00 0:30 JSURVEY @ 3936' 2 Deg. Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 14:30 4:30 [DRLG. F/3986' T/4175' 189' 42.0 fph Daily Total: $ 21,522
14:30 15:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Cum. Wir: $ 37,561
15:00 2:00 11:00 |DRLG. F/4175' T/4519' 344’ 31.3 fph fcum. Fuel $ 10,878
2:00 2:30 0:30 ISURVEY @ 4469' 2 Deg. Cum. Bits: $ 10,000
2:30 6:00 3:30 |DRLG. F/4519' T/4600' 81' 23.1 fph BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
IMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 6 1/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
23-61/4"DCY 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey 2 3936
Survey 2 4469'
P/U 140 LITH: 30% Limestone - 40% Shale - 30% Sandstone BKG GAS 10
$I0 130 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 135 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455' TRIP GAS
FUEL  Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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Y Zroy0-3473y
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 10/6/2004 Days: 10
Depth: 5429' |Prog: 829 |DHrs: 231/2 |AV ROP: 35.3 Formation: Surface
DMC: $4,605 TMC: $15,676 TDC: $36,945 |CWC: $570,376
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co:. M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
[mw: 84 1o  65x11 [Bits: 3 fconductor: 3 - |Loe,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
fpvIYP: Al #2a10m  6.5X10 |Type: DP 506 Z Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
IGeI: n ISPM: 105 |MFG: HC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 3822
IWL: N/IC GPM : 430  JsiN: 7105475 lFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
[Cake: JPross: 1050 Jets: 6X 16 IWoII Head: $ - |water: $ -
lSolids: 1 AV DC: 320 jin: 3465 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ 12,903
ISand: AV DP: 215  jout: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9.5 letvel: 287 |FTG: 1964 Tanks: $ - __|Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 84 JECD 85 IHrs: 58 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 12000 ISPR #: 425@60 IFPH: 33.9 |Hoater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: 300 @ 57 |wos: 10/15 IPumpIng ur: % - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
[Dapp ppb: 25 IBtm.Up: 19 IRPM: 60 /56 Prime Mover: $ - [Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 151 lDaIly Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 48605
6:00 18:00 12:00 |DRLG. F/4600' T/5020' 420' 35 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
18:00 18:30 0:30 |SURVEY @ 4970' 1 3/4 Deg. Csg. Crew: $ -
18:30 6:00 11:30 |DRLG. F/5020" T/5429' 409" 35.6 fph Daily Total: $ 36,945
Cum. Wir: $ 37,561
Cum. Fuel $ 23,781
Cum. Bits: $ 10,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
jMud Motor 6 1/4" 331
7 7/8" 1BS 61/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" |1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
23 -6 1/4"DC} 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey 13/4 4970
Survey
PiU 150 LITH: 80% Shale - 20% Sandstone BKG GAS 10
S/0 140 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 145 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL  Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG Date: 10/7/2004 Days: 11
Depth: 6135' |Prog: 706 |D Hrs: 22 1/2 |AV ROP: 31.4 Formation: Wasatch
DMC: $5,221 TMC: $20,897 TDC: $42,321 JCWC: $612,697
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
mw: 8.4 #145m  6.5X11 [Bit#: 3 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 1/1 [#2410m  6.5X10 [Type: DP 506 Z Iint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 11 SPM: 105 |MFG: HC Prod Csg: 3 - |Rental Tools: $ 1,800
WL: N/C GPM : 430 SIN: 7105475 Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $
Cake: Press: 1050 |Jets: 6X16 Well Head: $ - |wWater: $ 19,585
Solids: 1 AV DC: 320 |in: 3465 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
Sand: AV DP: 215  |out: Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
PH : 9 JotVel: 287 _|FTG: 2670 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PIIMf: 94.3 [eEcD 8.5 Hrs: 80 1/2 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 12000 [SPR#1: 425 @ 60 |FPH: 33.2 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 300 @ 57 |wWoB: 10/15 Pumping LT:  § - [Mud Motors:- $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: 5.4 Btm.Up: 23 RPM: 60 /56 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: | 0/0/0 Misc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME Rot, Hrs: 174 Daily Totat: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 5221
6:00 9:00 3:00 |DRLG. F/5429' T/5523' 94' 31.3 fph Misc. / Labor; $ -
9:00 9:30 0:30 |SURVEY @ 5473' 1 3/4 Deg. Csg. Crew: $ -
9:30 15:30 6:00 |DRLG. F/5523' T/5702' 179" 29.8 fph Daily Total: $ 42,321
15:30 16:00 0:30 |RIG SERVICE _ Cum, Witr: $ 57,146
16:00 2:00 10:00 |DRLG. F/5702' T/6026' 324' 32.4 fph Cum. Fuel $§ 23,781
2:00 2:30 0:30 |SURVEY @ 5976' 1 1/2 Deg. Cum. Bits: $ 10,000
2:30 6:00 3:30 |DRLG. F/6026' T/6135' 109" 31.1 fph BHA
7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/14"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" 188 6 1/4" 5.18
23-61/4"DCL 61/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey 13/4 5473
Survey 112 5976
P/U 165 LITH: 50% Shale - 50% Sandstone BKG GAS 10
S/0 155 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 160 LAST CSG.RAN. 85/8" SET @ 3459 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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Y 3-0Y7- 3699 DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT U i\ (« } 5*') ! [ ‘ fig,ﬁi L
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date:  10/8/2004 Days: 12
Depth: 6743' _|Prog: 608 |DHrs: 231/2 |AV ROP: 25.9 Formation: Wasatch
DMC: $963 TMC: $21,860 TDC: $18,478 JCWC: $631,175
Contractor: Nabors # 924 IMud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 8.4 I# 14sgem  6.5X11 IBit #: 3 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 SPM: Size: 778" JSurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
[PvIYP: 1 J#24100m  6.5X10 |JType: DP 506 Z Ilnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 1n SPM: 105  |MFG: HC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1900
| L N/IC GPM : 430  |SIN: 7105475 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 1050 LJets: 6X16 IWen Head: $ - |Water: $ -
Solids: 1 AV DC; 320 I 3465 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: AV DP: 215  Jout: [Packers: $ - {Mud Logger: $ 700
|PH : 9 JotVel: 287 [FTG: 3278 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 943 JecD 8.5 lHrs: 104 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior: 12000 |SPR#1: 525 @ 60 |FPH: 31.5 |Heator: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 |SPR#2: 400 @55 IWOB: 10/ 15 IPumplng uT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
[Dapp ppb: 54 IBtm.Up: 26 lRPM: 60 /56 IPrimo Mover: $ - [Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME fRot. Hrs: 196 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 963
6:00 21:30 15:30 |DRLG. F/6135' T/6527' 392' 25.3 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
21:30 22:00 0:30 JSURVEY @ 6577' 1 3/4 Deg. Ing. Crow: $ -
22:00 6:00 8:00 |DRLG. F/6527' T/6743' 216" 27.0 fph Daily Total: $ 18,478
[Cum. wir: $ 57,146
lCum. Fuel $ 23,781
ICUm. Bits: $ 10,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
{Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.1
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-614"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
23-6 1/4" DCY 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey 13/4 6577
Survey
P/U 175 LITH: 80% Shale - 20% Sandstone BKG GAS 10
SI0 170 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 165 LAST CSG.RAN: g8 5/8" SET 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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Y3-049-3993¢ DAL
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 10/9/2004 Days: 13
Depth: 7170' |Pro: 427 |[DHrs: 23 |AV ROP: 18.6 Formation: Dark Canyon
DMC: $1,046 TMC: $22,906 TDC: $18,561 JCWC: $649,736
Contractor: Nabors # 924 MudCo: M-l TANGIELE INTANGIBLE
MW: 8.4 I# 1asem  6.5X11 |Bit#: 3 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 ISPM: Slze: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
|pvive: 11 I# 2agm  6.5X10 [Type: DP 506 Z Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 11 SPM: 104 [MFG: HC lProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: NIC GPM : 426 lSIN: 7105475 lFIoat Equg: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: |Press: 1100 Lets: 6X 16 Well Head: $ - |Water: $ -
Isolids: 1 AV DC: 323 | 3465 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Eand: AV DP: 217 IOut: jPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 116 IFTG: Tanks: 5 - ogging: $ -
IPfIMf: 5/5.9  JECD 8.5 IHrs: |separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 11000 |SPR#1: 525 @ 60 - Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : 120  [sPR#2: 400 @ 55 JWOB: 10/15 IPumping uT: % - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: 5.2 IBtm.Up: 28 |rPM: 60/90 Primo Mover:  § - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMiac: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 219 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,046
6:00 15:30 9:30 JDRLG. F/6743 T/6965' 222' 23.4 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
15:30 16:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
16:00 23:30 7:30 |DRLG. F/6965 T/7059' 94' 12.5 fph Daily Total: $ 18,561
23:30 0:00 0:30 |SURVEY @ 7009' 1 1/2 Deg. Cum. Wtr: $ 57,146
0:00 6:00 6:00 |DRLG. F/7059' T/7170' 111" 18.5 fph Cum. Fuel $ 23,781
Cum. Bits: $ 10,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 114" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 6 1/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
236 1/4"DC] 6 114" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey 11/2 7009'
Survey
P/U 185 LITH: 10% Shale - 90% Sandstone BKG GAS 18
S$/0 175 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 180 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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Y3-049- 34994 -
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG, Date: 10/10/2004 |Days: 14
Depth: 7505 |Prog: 335 |D Hrs: 13 1/2 |AV ROP: 24.8 Formation: Dark Canyon
DMC: $656 TMC: $23,562 TDC: $25,171 |JCWC: $674,907
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 8.4 I# 1asgem  6.5X11 |Bit#: 3 4 IConductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 ISPM: Size: | 77/8" 77/8" |Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
feviye: 11 I# 2a1em  6.5X10 |Type: DPS06Z | DP 506 Z |int Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
IGoI: 11 ISPM: 104  |MFG: HC HC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
IWL: N/C IGPM : 426 ISIN: 7105475 | 7105474 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
ICako: IPrm: 1100  JJots: 6X16 6X 15 [Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
ISoIids: 1 AV DC: 323 jin: 3465 7210 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
ISand: AV DP: 217 IOut: 7210 IPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: 3 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 116 IFTG: 3745 295 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 559 |ECD 8.5 IHrs: 129 1/2 11 |Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
[Chlor: 12000 ISPR #: 525 @60 IFPH: 28.9 26.8 IHeater: $ - |Bits: $ 7,000
ICa : 120 ISPR #2: 400 @ 55 IWOB: 10/15 10/15 IPumping ur: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
lDapp ppb: 5.1 IBtm.Up: 29 IRPM: 60790 60/70 IPrimo Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 8/X/1 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME IRot. Hrs:] 2321/2 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 656
6:00 8:30 2:30 JORLG. F/7170' T/7210' 40' 16.0 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:30 12:00 3:30 JTRIP FOR MUD MOTOR ( NO TIGHT HOLE ) Ing. Crow: 3 -
12:00 14:00 2:00 JCHANGE BIT & MUD MOTOR Daily Total: $ 25171
14.00 18.00 4:00 JITRIP IN HOLE JCum. Wtr: $ 57,146
18:00 19:00 1:00 ]BREAK CIRC. & WASH 50' TO BTM. - NO FILL Curn. Fuel $ 23,781
19:00 6:00 11:00 |DRLG. F/7210' T/7505' 295" 26.8 fph [Cum. Bits: $ 17,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
IMud Motor 61/4" 33.11
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.14
Ishock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
23 -6 1/4"DC] 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey
Survey
PIU 185 LITH: 55% Shale - 45% Sandstone BKG GAS 8
S/0 185 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 185 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

43-092- 39934 o
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG, Date: 10/11/2004 |Days: 15
Depth: 7970' |Prog: 465 |D Hrs: 23 IAV ROP: 20.2 Formation: Dark Canyon
DMC: $911 TMC: $24,473 TDC: $18,426 |JCWC: $693,333
Contractor: Nabors # 924 MudCo: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
MW: 8.4 l# 1asem  6.5X11 [Bit#: 4 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 lSPM: lSIze: 778" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
[PVIYP: 1 I# 2a19m  6.5X10 [Type: DP 506 2 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
IGeI: n ISPM: 104  JMFG: HC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: N/C GPM : 426 ISIN: 7105474 lFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: 3 -
Cake: JPress: 1100 |Jets: 6X 15 lWell Head: $ - |water: $ -
[Solids: 1 AV DC: 323  |in: 7210 TBG/Rods: $ -  {Fueh $ -
Sand: AV DP: 217  Jout [Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 116  |FTG: 760 Tanks: $ - |togging: $ -
IPfIMf: 458 JECD : 8.5 IHrs: 34 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chilor: 12000 ISPR #1: 525@ 60 IFPH: 224 [Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
fca : 120 |SPR#2: 400 @ 55 |wWOB: 10/15 IPumping ur:  § - __|Mud Motors: $ 2500
IDapp ppb: 48 |Btm.up: 32 |rPM: 60/70 IPrima Mover: $ - |Corrosion: % 90
Time Break Down: ' T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:] 255 1/2 lDaity Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 911
6.00 7:30 1:30 JDRLG. F/7508' T/7563' 58' 38.7 fph Misc. / Labor: 3 -
7:30 8:00 0:30 JSURVEY @ 7513' 2 Deg. Csg. Crew: $ -
8:00 13:30 5:30 |DRLG. F/7563' T/7720" 157" 28.5 fph Daily Total: $ 18,426
13:30 14:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Jcum. wtr: $ 57,146
14:00 6:00 16:00 |DRLG. F/7720' T/7970' 250" 15.6 fph ICum. Fuel $ 23,781
ICum. Bits: $ 17,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
Mud Motor 61/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Ishock Sub | 6 174" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 614" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
23-61/4"DCY 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey 2 7513
Survey
PIU 200 LITH: 5% Shale - 95% Sandstone BKG GAS 8
S8/0 190 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 195 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date:  10/12/2004  |Days: 16
Depth: 8385' |Prog: 415 |DHrs: 23 |AV ROP: 18.1 Formation: Dark Canyon
DMC: $1,056 TMC: $25,529 TDC: $18,571 |CWC: $711,904
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: 8.4 |# Tasgpm  6.5X11 [Bit# 4 Iconductor: $ - |Loe,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 SPM: Size: 77/8" ISurI‘, Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ .
Ipvive: 1M1 [#240m  65X10 JType: DP 506 Z Ilnt. Csg: $ - |pay Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 1M1 ISPM: 104 'MFG: HC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: N/C GPM : 426  [S/N: 7105474 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: JPress: 1100 fJots: 6X15 Well Head: $ « _ |Water: $ -
ISolids: 1 AV DC: 323 jin: 7210 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
ISand: AV DP: 217 lOut: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 116 IFTG: 1175 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
leIMf: 549 |ECD 8.5 IHrs: 57 Iseparator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChlor: 12000 ISPR #1: 525 @ 60 IFPH: 20 3/5 IHoator: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : 120 ISPR #2: 400@ 55 IWOB: 10/15 IPumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: 4.4 IBtm.Up: 34 IRPM: 60/90 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ - |consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 278 1/2 lDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1,056
6:00 9:00 3:00 IDRLG. F/7970' T/8064' 94' 31.3 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:00 9:30 0:30 JSURVEY @ 8014' 2 1/4 Deg. Ing. Crow: $ -
9:30 16:30 7:00 IDRLG. F/8064' T/8175' 111' 15.9 fph Daily Total: $ 18,571
16:30 17:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE JCum. Wir: $ 57,146
17:00 6:00 13:00 |DRLG. F/8175' T/8385' 210" 16.2 fph ICum. Fuel $ 23781
ICurn. Bits: $ 17,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
[Mud Motor | 6 174" 33.11
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-614"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
23 -6 1/4" DC] 6 1/4" £89.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey 2 1/4 8014'
Survey
P/U 210 LITH: 5% Shale - 95% Sandstone BKG GAS 12
8§/0 200 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 205 LAST CSG.RAN: g 5/8" SET 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 124
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 10/13/2004 Days: 17
Depth: 8715’ lProg: 330 (D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 14.3 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $845 TMC: $26,374 TDC: $76,247 JCWC: $788,151
Contractor. Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
MwW: 8.4 I# 145em  6.5X11 |Bit#: 4 Conductor: $ - |Loe,Cost: $ 40,605
VIS: 26 ISPM: 'Size: 77/8" ISurf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
Ipvive: 11 I# 2419m  6.5X10 [Type: DP 506 Z Ilnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 1M ISPM: 104  [MFG: HC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL : NIC GPM 426 ISIN: 7105474 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 750
Cake: JPross: 1300 |Jots: 8X15 Well Head: $ - |water $ 602
Solids: 1 AV DC: 323 jim: 7210 TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuel: $ 15255
Sand: AV DP: 217 IOut: JPackers: $ -__|Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 116 IFTG: 1505 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 551 JECD : 8.5 IHrs: 80 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior: 13000 ISPR#1: 525 @ 60 IFPH: 18.8 JHeater: $ - |Bits: 3 -
Ca : 120 [sPR#2: 400 @ 55 IWOB: 10/15 lPumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
|Dapp ppb: 45 IBtm.Up: 35 IRPM: 60/90 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/B/G: g/0/0 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot Hrs:l 301 172 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 845
6:00 15:00 9:00 [DRLG. F/8385' T/8533' 148' 16.4 fph Misc. / Labor: $ 675
15:00 15:30 | 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Ing. Crew: $ -
15:30 17:30 | 2:00 JDRLG. F/8533' T/8564' 31 15.5 fph Daily Total: $ 76,247
17:30 18:00 0:30 JSURVEY @ 8514' 2 Deg. JCum. Wir: $ 57,748
18:00 6:00 12:00 JDRLG. F/8564' T/8715' 151' 12.6 fph ICum. Fuel $ 39,036
Cum. Bits: $ 17,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
{Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" 1BS 6 114" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
23-6 1/4"DC} 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774 87
Survey 2 8514
Survey
P/U 210 LITH: 55% Shale - 45% Sandstone BKG GAS 12
§I0 200 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 205 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 124
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

T ,
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 10/14/2004 |Days: 18
Depth: 9022' lProg: 307 D Hrs: 231/2 |AV ROP: 13.1 Formation: Dark Canyon
DMC: $1,723 TMC: $28,097 TDC: $19,238 JCWC: $807,389
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
mw: 8.4 I# 1asem  6.5X11 |Bit#: 4 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 ISPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - [Rig Move: $ -
fpvivp: 1" [# 2atgem  6.5X10 [Type: DP 506 Z Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 1 ISPM: 104 IMFG: HC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: N/C IGPM : 426 ISIN: 7105474 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: 3 -
Cake: Pross; 1400 [ets: 8X15 leII Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 1 AV DC: 323 Im: 7210 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
|sand: AV DP: 217 IOut: JPackers: $ - [Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JotVel: 116 IFTG: 1812 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 551 JECD 8.5 lHrs: 103 1/2 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChIor: 13000 ISPR #: 525 @60 IFPH: 17.5 JHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ea : 120 ISPR #2: 400 @ 55 |WOB: 10/15 |Pumplng UT: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2500
IDapp ppb: 4.5 IBtm.Up: 40 IRPM: 60/90 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 lMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 325 IDain Total: $ « | Drilling Mud: $ 1,723
6:00 20:00 | 14:00 |DRLG. F/8715' T/8949' 234' 16.7fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
20:00 20:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Ing. Crew: 3 -
20:30 6.00 9:30 [DRLG. F/8949' T/9022' 73' 7.7fph Daily Total: $ 19,238
Cum. Wtr: $ 57,748
Cum. Fuel $ 39,036
Cum. Bits: $ 17,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 7 718" 1.00
IMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub ] 6 1/4” 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 614" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
23 -6 1/4" DC| 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey
Survey
P/IU 215 LITH: 95% Shale - 5% Sandstone BKG GAS 12
S8/0 205 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 210 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 124
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT i o g i L
6/ 3-0 5/7)__ 35’7,7# Lo lul g LJ[ { !‘\
FED. 22-30-10-18 ' OPR: DRLG. Date:  10/15/2004 Days: 19
Depth: 9065’ |Prog: 43 D Hrs: 5172 IAV ROP: 7.8 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $1,634 TMC: $29,731 TDC: $26,149 |CWC: $833,538
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
jMw: 8.4 I# 1asgem  6.5X11 |BIt#: 4 5 Conductor: $ Lo¢,Cost: $ -
VIS: 26 SPM: Size: 778" 77/8"  |Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
IPVIYP; 11 #2u10m  6.5X10 [Type: DP 506 Z | DSX 199 Jint. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ 11,500
IGoI: in SPM: 104 |MFG: HC HYC lProd Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 1,900
IWL: N/C GPM : 426  ISIN: 7105474 lFIoat Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
ICake: {Press: 1300 Jets: 6X15 3/14 - 3/20 IWeH Head: $ Water: $ -
ISolids: 1 AV DC: 323  |in: 7210 9039 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
Sand: AV DP: 217 Qut: 9039 JPackers: $ Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 116  |FTG: 1829 26 Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 5147 |EcD : 8.5 lHrs: 108 1 |Separator: $ Cement; $ -
Chlor: 10000 ISPR#1: 525 @ 60 IFPH: 16.9 26 |Heater: $ Bits: $ 7,000
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 400 @ 55 Iwoa: 10/15 15-Oct IPumplng Ut  $ Mud Motors: $ 2,500
[Dapp ppb: 4.1 |Btm.Up: 38 IRPM: 60/90 B60/55 JPrime Mover: 3 Corrosion: $ g0
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 8IXI/1 0/0/0 lMisc: $ Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME Jrot. Hrs:f 329 1/2 3301/2 IDain Total: 3 Drilling Mud: $ 1634
6:00 8:30 2:30 |DRLG. F/9022' T/9034" 12' 4.8 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:30 9:00 0:30 JSURVEY @ 8984' 2 Deg. Csg. Crew: $ -
9:00 11:00 2:00 IDRLG. F/9034' T/9039' 5' 2.5 fph Daily Total: $ 26,149
11:00 18:30 7:30 JTRIP QUT FOR BIT ( NO TIGHT HOLE ) Cum. Wtr: $ 57,748
18:30 19:30 1:00 JCHANGE BIT & MUD MOTOR Cum. Fuel $ 39,036
19:30 1:30 6:00 JTRIP IN ( BREAK CIRC. @ 4500') Cum. Bits: $ 24000
1:30 5:00 3:30 JWASH & REAM FROM 8971' TO 9039' BHA
5:00 6:00 1:00 §DRLG. F/9039' T/9065' 26' 26' fph 7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 61/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
23-61/4"DC} 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey 2 8984
Survey
P/IU 215 LITH: 95% Shale - 5% Sandstone BKG GAS 12
S$/0 205 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 210 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3456 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 124
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

& 3-047- 349 3¢
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 10/16/2004  |Days: 20
Depth: 9419’ |Prog: 354 |DHrs: 231/2 JAV ROP: 15.1 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $956 TMC: $30,687 TDC: $25,696 |CWC: $859,134
Contractor: Nabors # 924 IMud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Jaw: 8.4 I# 14sm  6.5X11 IBit # 5 Jconductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
vIS: 26 ISPM: ISize: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
Ipvive: " I# 24mpm  B.5X10 [Type: DSX 199 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 1M ISPM: 104  MFG: HYC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
fwL: NIC GPM : 426 ISIN: 107890 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
ICake: |Press: 1300 Pets: 3/14 - 3/20 IWell Head: $ - |water: $ 7,125
ISOIids: 1 AV DC; 323 in; 9039 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
lSand: AV DP: 217 IOut: [Packers: $ - [Mud Logger: $ 700
I;’H : 9 JetVel: 116 IFTG: 380 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 5145 JECD 8.5 IHrs: 24 1/2 Separator: $ - |[Cement: $ -
Chlor: 10000 ISPR #1: 525@60 IFPH: 15.5 Heater: $ - |Blts: $ -
Ca: 120 ISPR #2: 400@ 55 IWOB: 10/15 IPumping ur.  $ - ]Mud Motors: $ 2500
IDapp ppb: 4 IBtm.Up: 39 IRPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME {Rot. Hrs:] 354 IDaily Total: $ - |Dritling Mud: $ 956
6:00 16:30 10:30 |DRLG. F/9065' T/9285' 220" 20.9 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
16:30 17.00 0:30 IRIG SERVICE Ing. Crow: $ -
17:00 6:00 13:00 |DRLG. F/9285' T/9419' 134' 10.3 fph Daily Total: $ 25,596
JCum. wtr: $ 64,873
Cum. Fuel $ 39,036
Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
IMud Motor 6 1/4" 3311
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 614" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
23-61/4"DCY 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey
Survey
P/U 215 LITH: 50% Shale - 45% Sandstone - 5% Coal BKG GAS 20
SI0 205 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 210 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Y3-090-349 24

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 10/17/2004 Days: 21
Depth: 9442’ lProg: 23 D Hrs: 2 AV ROP: 11.5 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $8,374 TMC: $39,061 TDC: $25,889 JCWC: $885,023
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: 8.9 I# 15 6.5X11 |Bit#: 5 6 {Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 30 ISPM: ISize: 77/8" 77/8" ISurf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
lpvrve: 3/ |# 2aim  B6.5X10 ltype: | DSX 199 M-70 Ilnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: n o |sem: 104 iMFG: HYC 8TC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
fw: 26 GPM 426 ISIN: 107890 JT 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
ICake: 1 Press: 1300 |Jets: 3/114 -3/20 | 4/14 - 3/20 lWeII Head: $ - |Water:
ISoIids: 3 AV DC: 323 Jin: 9039 9426  |TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuet: $ -
[Sand: Tr AV DP: 217 IOut: 9426 Packers: $ = __|Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JotVel: 116 IFTG: 387 16 Tanks: $ -___|Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 462 |ECD 8.5 IHrs: 25 1/2 1 |Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
lChlor: 10000 ISPR M: 525@ 60 IFPH: 15.2 16 IHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : 120 ISPR #2: 400 @ 55 IWOB: 10/15 10/15 IPumping ut: % - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
IDapp ppb: 54 IBtm.Up: 40 IRPM: 60 /55 55/55 |Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 8/XI/1 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 825
sTaRT | enp | mime [Rot. hrs:| 356 IoaiyTotat:  $ - |Dritling Mua: $ 8374
6.00 7:00 1:00 JDRLG. F/9419' T/9426' 7' 7 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
700 | 1330 | 6:30 |TRIP OUT FORBIT fcsg. crow: 5 .
13:30 14:30 1:00 JCHANGE BIT Daily Total: $ 25889
14:30 18:00 3:30 JTRIP IN TO CSG. SHOE JCum. Wir: $ 64,873
18:00 20:00 2:00 |SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE lCum. Fuel $ 39,036
20:00 | 21:00 | 1:00 [TRIP IN HOLE fcum. Bits: $ 24,000
21:00 1:30 4:30 JRIG REPAIR - WORK ON # 2 MOTOR BHA
1:30 3:30 2:00 |TRIP IN HOLE 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
3:30 5:00 1:30 IBREAK CIRC.& WASH 90' TO BTM fMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
5:00 6:00 1:00 JDRLG. F/9426' T/9442' 16' 16 fph 7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.14
1Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
23-61/4"DC] 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey
Survey
P/U 225 LITH: 50% Shale - 45% Sandstone - 5% Coal BKG GAS 20
S/0 215 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 220 LAST CSG.RAN: 856/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL  Used: On Hand: Co.Man $.L.Seely PEAK GAS 220
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: FISHING Date: 10/17/2004 Days: 21
Depth: 9505' IProg: 63 D Hrs: 3 |AV ROP: 21 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $1,667 TMC: $40,728 TDC: $19,782 JCWC: $904,805
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
[mw: o I#1ismm  65x11 fBitw: 6 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 32 SPM: Size: 778" |surt. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
IPVIYP: 4/2 J#2410m  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Ilnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 2/4 ISPM: 104  |MFG: 8TC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,800
WL: 28 GPM : 426 ISIN: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: 3 - |Trucking: $ 600
Cake: 1 {Press: 1400 Qets: 4/14 - 3/20 Woell Head: $ - |water:
Solids: 3 AV DC: 323 |in: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
|sand: Tr AV DP: 217  |out: {Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 100 |FTG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
[poms 454 JECD 9 IHrs: 4 |separator: $ - {cement: $ -
Chior: 10000 ISPR#1: 525 @ 60 [en: 19.8 IHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120  JSPR#2: 400 @ 55 JWOB: 10/15 IPumplng ur: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: 5 lBtm.Up: 40 IRPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down; TIBIG: 0/0/0 lMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:] 359 lDalIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1667
6:00 9:00 3:00 |DRLG. F/9442' T/9505' 63' 21 fph Misc. / Labor: 3 -
9:00 19:00 10:00 JRIG REPAIR - BURST VIB. HOSE ON MUD PUMP, VALVE ON Csg. Crew: $ -
# 2 PUMP WOULDN'T CLOSE TO ISOLATE # 1 PUMP, UNABLE  |Daily Total: $ 19,782
TQ CIRC. HOLE AND NO PARTS TO MAKE REPAIRS. TRIED TO  [Cum. Wtr: $ 64,873
PULL UP INTO SURF. CSG. - COULD ROT. BUT TIGHT COMING  JCum. Fuel $ 39,036
UP MADE 15' IN 4 Hrs. AND STOPPED MOVING. Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
19:00 22:00 3:00 JWORK STUCK PIPE & TRIED TO BREAK CIRC. AFTER PUMP BHA
REPAIRS - PACKED OFF 7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
22:00 6:00 8:00 IRIG UP COMPUTLOG AND FREE POINT. STUCK AT TOP OF D.C. JMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
BACKED OFF 1 JT. ABOVE BHA @ 8671’ 77/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.14
Jshock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-614"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
23-61/4"DC} 6 114" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey
Survey
P/J LITH: 45% Shale - 50% Sandstone - 5% Coal BKG GAS 20
$10 FLARE: CONN GAS 130
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS 1670
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

43-049-3497Y
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: JAR ON FISH Date: 10/18/2004 Days: 22
Depth: 9505' |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $6,075 TMC: $46,803 TDC: $46,829 |CWC: $951,634
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
fmw: 9.1 I# 14s0m  6.5X11 |Bit#: 6 Conductor: $ - |Lo¢,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 ISPM: ISize: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |RigMove: $ -
lpvrye: 14/11 I# 2419em  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 411 ISPM: 104 [MFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,800
WL: 16 IGPM : 426  |SIN: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: 3 - |Trucking: $ 520
Cake: 1 lPress: 1400 LJets: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ - |water: $ 410
Solids: 3 AV DC: 323 |fin: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ 15849
Sand: Tr AV DP: 217 IOut: jrackers: $ -___|Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 100 IFTG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 572  JECD 9 lHrs: 4 |Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 11000 |SPR #1: 525 @60 IFPH: 19.8 Heater: 3 - |its: $ -
jca : 120 SPR#2: 400 @ 55 IWOB: 10/15 IPumping LT 3 - |Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 6 1Btm.Up: 40 IRPM: 60/55 IPrimo Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/B/G: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:] 359 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 6,075
6:00 7:30 1:30 JRIG DOWN COMPUTLOG Misc. / Labor: $ 1,497
7:30 12:30 5:00 JCIRC. & COND. MUD Fishing: $ 7,463
12:30 18:00 5:30 |TRIP OUT TO PICK UP FISHING TOOLS Daily Total: $ 46,829
18:00 21:00 3:00 JPICK UP SCREW IN SUB, BUMPER SUB, JARS, 5-D.C. & EXCL. jcum. Wtr: $ 65,283
21:00 0:00 3:00 |TRIP IN HOLE Cum. Fuel $ 54,885
0:00 6:00 6:00 JSCREW INTO AND JAR ON FISH (NO MOVEMENT YET) fcum. Bits: $ 24,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
IMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.1
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 61/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
23 - 6 1/4" DC] 6 1/4" 689.31
TOTAL BHA = 774.87
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: PICK UP WASH PIPE Date: 10/19/2004 Days: 23

Depth: 9505' |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $577 TMC: $47,380 TDC: $31,428 JCWC: $986,062

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: 9.1 I# 1asgm  65X11 [Bit#: 6 Conductor: $ - |Loe,Cost: $ -

VIS: 45 SPM: Size: 7 7/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
pvivp: 1411 [#240m  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500

Gel: 4/11 SPM: 104 |MFG: §TC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 16 GPM : 426  |SIN: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - __|Trucking: $ 600

Cake: 1 JPress: 1400  JJets: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ - |Water:

Solids: 3 AV DC: 323 Pn: 9426 TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel: $ -
ISand: Tr AV DP; 217 Qut; JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 100 JFTG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 572 JECD 9 IHrs: 4 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -

Chlor: 11000 |SPR#1: 525 @ 60 IFPH: 19.8 |Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -

Ca : 120 SPR#2: 400 @ 55 JWOB: 10/15 |Pumping L/T: 3 - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
|Dapp ppb: 6 |Btm.Up: 40 IRPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ a0

Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 359 [Dai|y Total: $ - |Pprilling Mud: $ 577
6:00 10:00 4.00 JJAR ON FISH Misc. / Labor: $ -
10:00 20:00 10:00 JFREE POINT & BACK OFF@ TOP OF FISH WITH COMPUTLOG Fishing: $ 12,736
20:00 1:00 5:00 |TRIP QUT WITH FISHING TOOLS Daily Total: $ 31,428
1:00 6:00 5:00 |JSTRAP & PICK UP 6 JTS. WASH PIPE jcum. wir: $ 65283
Cum. Fuel $ 54,885
Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
FISH

7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
[Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.14
}Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
WASH PIPE ASSEMBLY - SHOE, 6 Jts. W.P., TOP SUB, 1-61/4"DC | 614" 30.73
BUMPER SUB, JAR, C/O, 5-6"DC, C/O, INT, C/O 7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
370.18' TOTAL 23-61/4"DC| 6 1/4" 689.31
1-Jt. DP 412" 31.45
TOTAL BHA = 806.29

Survey

Survey

P/U LITH: BKG GAS

$/0 FLARE: CONN GAS

ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: WASH OVER FISH Date: 10/20/2004 Days: 24
Depth: 9505 |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $1,022 TMC: $49,302 TDC: $17,632 |CWC: $1,003,694
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co:. M-| TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
jmMw: 9.1 l# 14sm  6.5X11 |Bit#: 6 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 ISPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
feviye; 14/11 l# 24m  6.5X10 |Type: M-70 lint. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 411 ISPM: 104 IMFG: STC IProd Csg: 3 Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL 10 GPM : 426  JSIN: JT - 6485 IFloat Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
lCake: 1 jPress: 1400 JJeots: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ Water:
Solids: 3 AV DC: 323 fin: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: 3 -
Sand: Tr AV DP: 217 Jout: JPackers: $ Mud Logger: $ 700
[PH : 9 JetVel: 100 FTG: 79 Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 572 JECD : 9 Hrs: 4 Soparator: $ Cement: $ -
Chior: 11000 |SPR#1: 525 @ 60 JFPH: 19.8 JHeator: $ Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 400 @ 55 JWOB: 10/ 15 IPumpIng ur: % Mud Motors: $ -
[Dapp ppb: 54 jBtm.Up: 40 |RPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: $ Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BI/G: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME |Rot. Hrs:| 359 IDain Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ 1922
6:00 8:00 2:00 JPICK UP WASH PIPE Misc. / Labor: $ 695
8:00 8:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
8:30 11:00 2:30 |[W.0.TOOLS Daily Total: $ 17,632
11:00 15:30 4:30 |TRIP IN HOLE Cum. Wtr: $ 65283
15:30 16:00 0:30 JCIRC. & COND. @ TOP OF FISH 8671 Cum. Fuel $§ 54,885
16:00 6:00 14:00 [WASH OVER FISH F/8671' T/8821' - FIRST 80' WASHED OVER  jCum. Bits: $ 24,000
VERY HARD THEN STARTED TO FREE UP - WASHING EASY FISH
WITH LITTLE WT. OR TORQUE THE LAST 70' 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 718" 1BS 6 1/4" 514
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
WASH PIPE ASSEMBLY - SHOE, 6 Jts. W.P., TOP SUB, 23-61/4"DC] 6 1/4" 689.31
BUMPER SUB, JAR, C/O, 5-6"DC, C/O, INT, C/O 1-Jt. DP 41/2" 31.45
370.18' TOTAL TOTAL BHA = 806.29
Survey
Survey
P/U 0 LITH: BKG GAS
$/0 0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: FREE POINT FISH Date: 10/21/2004 Days: 25
Depth: 9505' |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $3,798 TMC: $53,100 TDC: $20,725 JCWC: $1,024,419
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
jaw: 9.1 I# 1asgem  6.5X11 JBit #: 6 Iconductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
Ieviye: 118  [#2419pm  B.5X10 [Type: M-70 ilnt. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 4/9 SPM: 104  [MFG: 8TC IProd Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 1,900
Wi 11 GPM : 426  JsiN: JT - 6485 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPress: 1400 |Jets: 4/14 - 3/20 (Well Head: 3 Water: $ 1,912
Solids: 3 AV DC: 323  pn: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: 217  jout: Packers: $ Mud Logger: $ 700
PH : 9 JetVel: 100  |F1G: 79 Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
PfIMf: 4/53  JECD 9 IHrs: 4 jSeparator: $ Cement: $ -
Chior: 9000 ISPR #1: 525@60 [Fen: 19.8 Heater. $ Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: 400 @ 55 |WOB: 10/15 IPumping L/T: $ Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 4.9 IBtm.Up: 40 {RPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: 3 Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:} 359 IDaily Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ 3,798
6:00 7:30 1:30 JWASH OVER FISH WITH 6 JTS. W.P. T/8854' (1-DP & 5-DC) Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:30 8:00 0:30 JCIRC. & COND. Csg. Crew: $ -
8:00 14:30 6:30 |TRIP QUT & STAND BACK W.P. Daily Total: $ 20,725
14:30 15:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE jCum. Wtr: $ 67,195
15:00 21:00 6:00 |TRIP IN HOLE Cum. Fuel § 54,885
21:00 21:30 0:30 |CIRC. @ TOP OF FISH 8671 Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
21:30 2:30 5:00 |SCREW INTQ & JAR ON FISH ( NO MOVEMENT ) FISH
2:30 6:00 3:30 JRIG UP COMPUTLOG AND RUN FREE PQINT 7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 514
FISHING STRING - SCREW IN SUB, BUMPER SUB, JShock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
JARS, C/O, 5 -6" DC, C/O, INT, C/O, 1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
23 -6 1/4"DC| 6 1/4" 689.31
1-.Jt. DP 41/ 31.45
TOTAL BHA = 806.29
Survey
Survey
P/IU LITH: BKG GAS
$I0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man $S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: FREE POINT FISH Date: 10/22/2004 Days: 26
Depth: 9505' [Prog: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $544 TMC: $53,644 TDC: $16,884 |CWC: $1,041,303
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: 9 I# 1aspm  6.5X11 [Bit#: 6 Conductor: $ - |Loc¢,Cost: $ -
vIS: 48 SPM: ISize: 77/8" jsurf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
lpvryp: 16114 [#2410m  B6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Ilnt. Csg: $ -  |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 47 SPM: 104 |MFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 11 GPM : 426 SIN: JT - 6485 IFloat Equp: $ - ITrucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPross: 1400 |lJets: 4/14 - 3/20 lWelI Head: $ - |Water: $ -
Solids: 3 AV DC: 323 |im: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: 217 Jout: JPackers: $ - __{Mud Logger: $ 700
IpH : 9 JotVel: 100 |FTG: 79 Tanks: $ - __|Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/5.3 JECD 9 IHrs: 4 Separator; $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior: 9000 JSPR#1: 525 @ 60 [een: 19.8 {Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 400 @ 55 [WOB: 10/ 15 IPumping LIT: $ - {Mud Motors: $ -
[Dapp ppb: 54 {Btm.Up: 40 IRPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME Jrot. Hrs:} 359 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 544
6:00 10:00 4:00 |FREE POINT +/- 50% FREE IN STAB. @ 9399' Misc. / Labor: $ 1,325
10:00 18:00 8:00 JATTEMPT TO BACK OFF STAB @ 9399' - SHOT 2 TIMES WITH Ing. Crow: $ -
7 TURNS TO THE LEFT WOULDN'T BACK OFF Daily Total: $ 16,884
18:00 19:30 1:30 JJAR ON FISH Cum. Wir: $ 67,195
19:30 21:30 2:00 JFREE POINT +/- 50% FREE IN STAB. @ 9399' - NO GAIN Cum. Fuel $ 54885
21:30 2:00 4:30 |PERF. 4 SHOTS @ 9397' ( FISHING NECK OF STAB.) Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
2:00 5:00 3:00 JKELLY UP AND ATTEMPT TO CIRC. PRESSURE BLEADING OFF FISH
VERY SLOW WHILE JARING - NO GAIN IN MOVEMENT 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
5:00 6:00 1:00 {FREE POINT IMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 514
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4". 30.73
7 7/18" IBS 61/4" 5.16
FISHING STRING - SCREW IN SUB, BUMPER SUB, 23-6 1/4"DC| 6 114" 689.31
JARS, C/O, 5 - 6" DC, C/O, INT, C/O, 1-Jt. DP 41/2" 31.45
TOTAL BHA = 806.29
Survey
Survey
PIU 0 LITH: BKG GAS
810 0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: TRIP IN HOLE WITH WASH PIPE |Date: 10/23/2004 Days: 27
Depth: 9505' |Prog: D Hrs: |AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $2,000 TMC: $55,644 TDC: $47,013 JCWC: $1,088,316
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
jmw: 9.1 21 wsen  B.5X11 |Bit#: 6 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
|PVIYP: 11/8 [ 2419m 6.5X10 {Type: M-70 jint. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 49 SPM: IMFG: STC lProd Csq: $ Rental Tools: $ 1,900
fwL: 11 GPM : SIN: JT - 6485 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPress: Jets: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ Water: $ -
Solids: 3 AV DC: In: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: 3 -
Sand: Tr AV DP: Qut: JPackers: $ Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: IFTG: 79 Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .5/5.8 JECD |Hrs: 4 Separator: $ Cement: $ -
IChIor: 9000 ISPR #": IFPH: 19.8 |Heater: $ Bits: $ -
ICa : 120 Ispn #2: lwos: 10/15 IPumping ut: % Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp pph: 57 IBtm.Up: lRPM: 60 /55 IPrimo Mover: $ Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JrRot. Hrs:| 359 IDain Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ 2,000
6:00 17:30 11:30 JFREE POINT AND BACK OFF @ 8881' RECOVERED 1 JT. D.P. Misc. / Labor: $ -
AND 6 JTS. D.C. lFishing: $ 29,998
17:30 19:00 1:30 JCIRC. & COND. Daily Total: $ 47,013
19:00 1:30 6:30 JTRIP OQUT WITH FISH ( CHAINED QUT ) Cum. Wtr: $ 67,195
1:30 3:00 1:30 JLAY DOWN TOOLS & PICK UP WASH PIPE Cum. Fuel $ 54885
3:00 6:00 3.00 JTRIP IN HOLE WITH 8 - JTS. WASH PIPE Cum. Bits: $ 24000
FISH
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
IMud Motor 61/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-614"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
17-61/4"DC| 6 1/4" 505.31
TOTAL BHA = 590.87
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S$/I0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455' TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: WASH OVER FISH Date: 10/25/2004 Days: 29
Depth: 9505' [Prog: . D Hrs: |AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $510 T™MC: $56,154 TDC: $15,5625 |JCWC: $1,103,841
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
IMw: 9.1 I# 1esem  6.5X11 [Bit#: 6 Conductor; $ - Loc,Cost: 3 -
VIS: 45 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - {Rig Move: $ -
IpvivP: 11/8 240w 65X10 [Type: M-70 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 4/9 ISPM: 104  |MFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
JwL: 11 GPM : 426 S/N: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPress: 1400 eots: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 3 AV DC: 323 |mn: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
ISand: Tr AV DP: 217 Qut: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
[PH : 9 JotVel: 100 |FTG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 453 |JECD 9 IHrs: 4 Separator: $ - lCement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 ISPR #1: 525 @ 60 IFPH: 19.8 JHeater: 3 - Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 400 @ 55 |wOB: 10/ 15 lPumping ut:  § - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 4.9  {Btm.Up: 40 |rPM: 60/55 Prime Mover:  § - |[Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:} 359 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 510
6:00 9:00 3:00 |TRIP INWITH 8 JTS. WASH PIPE Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:00 12:30 3:30 |SLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE Csg. Crew: $ -
12:30 16:30 4:00 |TRIP IN WITH WASH PIPE ( TIGHTEN EVERY JT.OF D.P.) Daily Total: $ 15,525
16:30 6:00 13:30 JWASH OVER 8 D.C. F/8881' T/9129' - WASHED EASY EXCEPT Cum, Wtr: $ 67,195
FOR HARDBANDS ON D.C. Cum. Fuel $ 54,885
Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
FISH
7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 114" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 61/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 614" 30.73
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
17-61/4" DCY 6 1/4" 505.31
TOTAL BHA = 590.87
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
SI0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455’ TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Y B3-0Y0-39974

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: TRIP OUT WITH WASH PIPE  |Date: 10/26/2004  |Days: 30
Depth: 9505 _ |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $2,452 TMC: $58,606 TDC: $20,537 |CWC: $1,124,378
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw; 9.1 I# Tasgpm  6.5X11 [Bit#: 6 Conductor; $ - [Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 ISPM: Size: 7 718" Jsurt. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
|PVIYP: 10/7 I# 2419pm  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Ilnt. Csg: $ - |pay Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 3/5 ISPM: |MFG: STC lProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL.: 11 IGPM : SIN: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - [Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 IPress: Jets: 4/14 - 3120 Well Head: $ - |water: 3 -
Solids: 3 AV DC: Iin: 9426 TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel: $ -
|Sand: Tr AV DP: Out: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: JFrG: 79 Tanks: $ - __|Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/57  JECD IHrs: 4 Separator: $ - JCement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 SPR #1 : IFPH: 19.8 JHeater: $ - Bits: 5 -
Ca : 120 SPR #2 : IWOB: 10/15 lPumpIng L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 5.3 |Btm.Up: IRPM: 60/55 IPrime Mover: $ - [Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 Imisc: $ - IConsultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:] 359 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilting Mud: $ 2,452
6:00 7:00 1:00 JCIRC. & PUMP PILL FOR TRIP QUT WITH WASH PIPE Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:00 1:30 18:30 JWORK TIGHT HOLE - FIRST JT. CAME OUT FREE THEN WASH IFishing: $§ 3070
PIPE STARTED TO PULL TIGHT - JAR & WORK 6 JTS. OUT Daily Total: $ 20,537
BEFORE IT CAME FREE Cum. Wtr: $ 67,195
1:30 4:30 3:00 JCIRC. & COND. HOLE - GETTING TAR SAND OVER SHAKER Cum. Fuel $ 54,885
4:30 6:00 1:30 |TRIP OUT WITH WASH PIPE Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
FISH
7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
IMud Motor 6 114" 33.11
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
17 -6 1/4" DC] 6 1/4" 505.31
TOTAL BHA = §90.87
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
§/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: JAR ON FISH Date: 10/27/2004 Days: 31
Depth: 9505’ _ |Prog: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $3,176 TMC: $61,782 TDC: $22,616 JCWC: $1,146,994
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
fMw: 9.1 I# 1aspm  6.5X11 |Bit#: 6 Conductor: $ - |Loe,Cost: 3 -
VIS: 45 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
levive: 1178 [#2ugm  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 4/9 SPM: IMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ ~  |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 11 GPM : SIN: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 675
Cake: 1 fPross: Jots: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ - lwater: $ 3750
Solids: 3 AV DC: Jin: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - {Fuel: $ -
Sand; Tr AV DP: Out: frackers: $ - {Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: IFTG: 79 Tanks: $ - __|Logging: 3 -
IPfIMf: 453  JECD [-lrs: 4 fseparator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 SPR #1: IFPH: 19.8 Heater: $ -  |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR #2: WOB: 10/15 JPumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 4.9 |Btm.Up: JRPM: 60 /55 Prime Mover: 3 - |Corrosion: $ 20
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 Misc: $ - |consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:] 359 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 3178
6:00 10:30 4:30 ITRIP OUT WITH WASH PIPE Misc. / Labor: $ -
10:30 16:30 6:00 |STAND BACK WASH PIPE AND CHANGE JAR, BUMPER 8. Csg. Crew: $ -
16:30 20:30 | 4:00 |TRIP IN HOLE Daily Total: $ 22,616
20:30 22:00 1:30_|CIRC. @ TOP OF FISH 8881’ Cum. Wtr: $ 70945
22:00 6:00 8:00 JISCREW INTO AND JAR ON FISH - NO MOVEMENT YET Cum. Fuel $ 54885
Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
FISH
7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
JMud Mator 5 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
FISHING STRING - SCREW IN SUB, BUMPER SUB, 7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
JARS, C/O, 5-6"DC, C/Q, INT, C/O, 17 -6 1/4" DC] 6 1/4" 505.31
TOTAL BHA = 590.87
Survey
Survey
P/U 0 LITH: BKG GAS
S§/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: GOING IN TO BACK OFF Date: 10/28/2004 Days: 32
Depth: 9505' |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $694 TMC: $62,476 TDC: $16,216 JCWC: $1,163,210
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 9.1 I# fasgem  6.5X11 [Bit# 6 Conductor: $ - lLoe¢,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: Size: 7 7/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |RIig Move: $ -
|pvrve: 1111 #2410m  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 {int. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 47 ISPM: IMFe: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,800
Jwi: 1 GPM : SIN: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 |Press: Jets: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ - |water: $ 507
|solids: 3 AV DC: jin: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ ~__|Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: Out: Packers: 3 - ___|Mud Logger: $ 700
jPH : 9 JatVel: IFTG: 79 Tanks: 3 - |Logging: 3 -
IPfIMf: 453 |Jecp IHrs: 4 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChlor: 9000 SPR #1 : IFPH: 19.8 Heator: 3 - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120  JsPrR#2: WOB: 10/15 Pumping LIT:  § - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 47 IBtm.Up: IRPM: B60/55 jPrime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/01/0 IMisc: $ - |Consuitant: $ 825
START END TIME Rot. Hrs:] 359 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 694
6:00 8:30 2:30 |JAR ON FISH - NO MOVEMENT Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:30 10:30 2:00 JREPAIR LOW CLUTCH CHAIN Csg. Crew: $ -
10:30 6:00 19:30 |RAN COMPUTLOG WIRE LINE CORE BARREL TO CLEAN QUT Daily Total: $ 16,216
FISH F/8881' T/9356' - FREE POINT - FREE T/9216' - RUNNING Cum. Wtr: $ 71452
IN TO ATTEMPT BACK OFF TO RECOVER 11 MORE D.C. Cum. Fuel $ 54,885
Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
FISH
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/18" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC } 6 1/4" 30.73
FISHING STRING - SCREW IN SUB, BUMPER SUB, 7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
JARS, C/O, 5 - 6" DC, C/O, INT, C/O, 17 -6 174" DC| 6 1/4" 505.31
TOTAL BHA = 590.87
Survey
Survey
PIU LITH: BKG GAS
$/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT Date:  10/29/2004 Days: 33
Depth: 9505’ IProg: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $87 TMC: $62,563 TDC: $36,356 JCWC: $1,199,566
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: 9.1 I# 1asem  6.5X11 ]IBit#: 6 Conductor; $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
|PVIYP: 118 W 24m  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 JInt. Csg: $ -  |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 49 ISPM: IMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 1 GPM SIN: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - Trucking: $ 420
Cake: 1 JPress: Jets: 4/14 - 3120 Well Hoad: $ - |water: $ -
|Solids: 3 AV DC: Pn: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: Qut: |Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IpH 9 JetVel: JFrG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/53 JECD IHrs: 4 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior: $000 ISPR #1: IFPH: 19.8 JHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2 : WOB: 10/15 IPumping LIT: 3 - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 49 IBtm.Up: IrPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: 3 - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 359 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 87
6:00 8:00 2:00 IWORK IN LEFT HAND TORQUE & BACK OFF @ 9210' Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:00 18:00 10:00 |TRIP QUT ( TIGHT FOR FIRST 2 STD.) STRING PLUGGED & WET IFishing: $ 20834
18:00 0:00 6:00 JLAY DOWN FISHING TOOLS,STAND BACK FISH & PICK UP BIT |Daily Total: $ 36,356
0:00 6:00 6:00 |TRIP IN WITH BIT AND 5§ D.C. TO CLEAN QUT TO TOP OF FISH  JCum. Wtr: $ 71452
Cum. Fuel $ 54,885
RECOVERED 11 D.C. Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
FISH
PLUGGED BTM. D.C. WHILE WORKING TIGHT HOLE |7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
AFTER BACK OFF Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 61/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 614" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
[6-614"DC | 61/4" 180.41
TOTAL BHA = 265.97
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
8I0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (@ 345% TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L Seely PEAK GAS
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7’/0\9 f/gf S DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT
Y3-0Y 7~ 39779
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: WASH & REAM @_9045' Date: 10/30/2004 Days: 34
Depth: 9505 lProg: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $4,868 TMC: $67,431 TDC: $19,883 JCWC: $1,219,449
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 9.6 I# Tasm  6.5X11 ]Bit#: 6 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 70 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
lpvive: J#24m  6.5X10 (Type: M-70 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: ISPM: IVMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: GPM SIN: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPress: Jets: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Hoad: $ - |Water: $ -
|solids: 5 AV DC: In: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: Out: Jrackers: 3 - [Mud Logger: $ 700
JpH 9 JotVel: IFTG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/53 |ECD lHrs: 4 JSeparator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior; 9000  |SPR#1: IFPH: 19.8 |Heater: § - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: IWOB: 10/15 IPumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 59 {Btm.Up: IRPM: 60/55 |Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 359 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 4,868
6:00 7:00 1:00 JTRIP IN HOLE Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:00 6:00 23:00 JWASH & REAM FROM 8845' TO 9045' INC. MUD WT. TO 9.6 Csg. Crew: $ -
VIS. TO 65 - HOLE CAVING BACK IN AFTER WASHING KELLY Daily Total: $ 19,883
DOWN HAVING TO RE-DRILL MANY TIMES BEFORE WE CAN Cum. Wir: $ 71,452
MAKE A CONNECTION - LARGE PIECES OF SHALE COMING jcum. Fuel $ 54885
OVER SHAKER Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
FISH
7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
{Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
fShock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 6 1/4" 30.73
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
j6-61/4"DC | 614" 180.41
TOTAL BHA = 265.97
Survey
Survey
P/IU LITH: BKG GAS
SI0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Y3 049~ 3977y
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: SHORT TRIP Date: 10/31/2004 Days: 35
Depth: 9505 |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $4,948 TMC: $72,379 TDC: $19,963 |CWC: $1,239,412
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
jmw: 9.5 I# 14som  6.5X11 IBit#: 6 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 60 ISPM: Size: 778" JSurf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
fpviye: 14/20 I# 2ugm  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Ilnt. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 14/24 ISPM: IMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 1,900
jwL: 15 GPM S/N: JT - 6485 lFloat Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPress: Jots: 4/14 - 3/20 Wall Head: $ Water: $ -
Solids: 7 AV DC: In: 9426 TBG/Rods: 3 Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: Out: |Packers: $ Mud Logger: $ 700
IpH : 9 JetVel: FTG: 79 Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 556  |ECD Hrs: 4 Separator: $ Cement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 SPR #1 : IFPH: 19.8 JHeateor: $ Bits: $ -
Ca : 80 SPR #2 : WOB: 10/15 IPumping ut: % Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 55 |Btm.Up: IRPM: 60 /55 Prime Mover: % Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:l 359 IDain Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ 4,948
6:00 18:30 12:30 JWASH & REAM F/9045' T/9210' (TOP OF FISH) Misc. / Labor: $ -
18:30 21:00 2:30 |CIRC. & COND. Csg. Crew: $ -
21:00 23:30 2:30 |SHORT TRIP 10 STDS. (HAD TO PUMP FIRST 7 JTS. OUT) Daily Total: $ 19,963
23:30 3:30 4:00 JWASH & REAM F/9074' T/9210' (TOP OF FISH) Cum. Wtr: $ 71,452
3:30 5:30 2:00 JCIRC. & COND. Cum. Fuel $ 54,885
5:30 6:00 0:30 |SHORT TRIP 3 STDS. (HAD TO PUMP FIRST 3 JTS. OUT) Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
FISH
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
[Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.16
[6-61/4"DC | 61/4" 180.41
TOTAL BHA = 265.97
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
§/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET (@ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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Y 3 050 39774
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: TRIP IN WITH WASH PIPE Date: 11/01/2004 Days: 36
Depth: 9505' _ |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $2,209 TMC: $74,588 TDC: $17,789 JCWC: $1,257,201
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw; 9.5 I# 1asem  6.5X11 |Bit#: 6 Conductor: $ - lLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 60 ISPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
|pvrve: 14/20 l# 24190m  6.5X10 |Type: M-70 jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 14/24  |SPM: MFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,800
WL: 15 GPM : SIN: JT - 6485 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 |Pross: Jats: 4/14 - 3/20 Woll Head: $ - Iwater: $ -
Solids: 7 AV DC: {in: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: Out: JPackers: $ - {Mud Logger: $ 700
|PH : 9 JetVel: IFTG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 5/5.6 |ECD IHrs: 4 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 ISPR #1: IFPH: 19.8 |Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 80 ISPR #2: WOB: 10/15 IPumpIng UT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 55 IBtm.Up: IRPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 359 IDain Total: $ - |Drilting Mud: $ 2209
6:00 11:00 5:00 JWASH & REAM F/9045' T/9210' AND COND.HOLE TO WASHOVER [Misc. / Labor: $ 565
11:00 20:00 9:00 JTRIP OUT FOR WASH PIPE LAY DOWN 7 JTS.D.P. Csg. Crew: $ -
20:00 0:00 4.00 JPICK UP 6 JTS. WASH PIPE BUMPER SUB & JARS Daily Total: $ 17,789
0:00 6:00 6:00 JTRIP IN WITH WASH PIPE Cum. Wtr: $ 71,452
Cum. Fuel $ 54,885
Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
TIGHT SPOT F/9045' T/9210' APPEARS TO FISH
BE STABILIZED - WHILE WASHING OVER 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
WE WILL ADD 3 # BBL. ASPHASOL JMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shaock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-614"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
je-6114"0C | 61/4" 180.41
TOTAL BHA = 265.97
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S§/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: MILLING ON IBS @ 9392 Date: 11/02/2004 Days: 37
Depth: 9505 ]Prog: D Hrs: lAV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $492 TMC: $75,080 TDC: $17,228 |CWC: $1,274,429
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: 9.4 I# tasgem  6.5X11 Bit#: 6 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS; 65 SPM: ISize: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
levrye: 1820 #2410m  6.5X10 |Type: M-70 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 12/24 SPM: MFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 12 GPM : S/N: JT - 6485 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: 3 920
Cake: 1 JPress: Jets: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ - |Water: $ -
Solids: 8 AV DC: jin: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: Out: |Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: FTG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 459 |ECD Hrs: 4 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 SPR #1: FPH: 19.8 JHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR #2 : WOB: 10/ 15 IPumping ut: § - |Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 57 |Btm.Up: RPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 80
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consuiltant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:} 359 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 492
6:00 9:30 3:30 {TRIP IN HOLE T/911%' Misc. / Labor: $ 801
9:30 12:00 2:30 |BREAK CIRC. AND WASH F/9115' T/9210' - TOP OF FISH Csg. Crew: $ -
12:00 2:30 8:30 JWASH OVER FISH F/9210' T/9392' - TOP OF TOP IBS Daily Total: $ 17,228
2:30 6:00 3:30 IMILL ON IBS @ 9392' jcum. wtr: $ 71,452
Cum. Fuel $ 54,885
Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
FISH
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 514
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
16-614"DC | 6 1/4" 180.41
TOTAL BHA = 265.97
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS 50
S/0 FLARE: CONN GAS 250
ROT. LLAST CSG.RAN: 85/8” SET (@ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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4 3-050- 3979y
FED. 22-30-10-18 ' OPR: JAR ON FISH Date: 11/03/2004 Days: 38
Depth: 9505' |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: . |Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $15,400 TMC: $90,480 TDC: $30,415 JCWC: $1,304,844
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
IMw: 9.4 I# fasem  65X11 [Bit# 6 |Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 65 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
{PVIYP: 18/20 #2430  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Jint. Csg: $ - __|Day Rate: $ 11,500
IGeI: 12124 ISPM: JMFG: STC lProd Csg: $ - IRental Tools: $§ 1,900
IWL: 12 GPM ISIN: JT - 6485 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPross: Jots: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ - |Wwater: 3 -
Solids: 8 AV DC: In: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - [Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: Out: |Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
|pH : 9 JotVel: |FrG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 459 |ECD IHrs: 4 Separator: $ - |Cement: 3 -
Chior: 9000 ISPR # . IFPH: 19.8 [Heater: $ - Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: WOB: 10/15 IPumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
[Dapp ppb: 57 |Btm.Up: IRPM: 60/55 IPrimo Mover: $ - |corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ - [consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 359 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Driling Mud: $ 15,400
6:00 7:00 1:00 [MILL ON IBS @ 9392' Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:00 16:00 9:00 |TRIP QUT - PUMPED QUT FIRST 8 JTS. Csg. Crew: ¥ -
16:00 19:00 3:00 JLAY DOWN WASH PIPE Daily Total: $ 30,415
19:00 1:.00 6:00 |TRIP IN WITH SCREW IN SUB, BUMPER SUB, AND JARS Cum. Wtr: $ 71,452
1:00 3:30 2:30 JWASH F/9060' T/9210' - TOP OF FISH Curm. Fuel $ 54,885
3:30 6:00 2:30 JJUAR ON FISH - NO MOVEMENT YET Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
FISH
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" I1BS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
16-61/4"DC | 61/4" 180.41
TOTAL BHA = 265.97
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS 50
SI0 FLARE: CONN GAS 250
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3458 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man $S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: CLEAN QUT INSIDE OF FISH |Date: 11/04/2004 Days: 39
Depth: 9505' |Prog: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $2,434 TMC: $92,914 TDC: $19,211 JCWC: $1,324,055
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
IMW: 9.4 l# 1asgem  6.5X11 |BIt#: 6 Conductor: $ - |{Loc,Cost: $ -
vIS: 65 ISPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
1PVIYP: 18/20 I# 2419m  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Jint. Csg: $ -  |Dpay Rate: $ 11,500
|Gol: 12/24 ISPM: IMFG: STC lProd Csg: $ -  |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
IWL: 12 GPM : |sm: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: 3 -
lCako: 1 |Press: Jets: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ - |water: $ 1762
Solids: 8 AV DC: jin: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: IOut: Ipackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
fpH : 9 JetVel: fFre: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/5.9 JECD Hrs: 4 Separator; 3 - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 ISPR #1: JFPH: 19.8 JHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: |WOB: 10/15 IPumplng ur:  § - |Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 5.7 IBtm.Up: IRPM: 60 /55 Prime Mover: $ - ICorrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:f 359 IDaHy Totak: $ - |Drilling Mud: § 2434
6:00 11:30 5:30 JJAR ON FISH - NO MOVEMENT Misc. / Labor: $ -
11:30 2:00 14:30 JRIG UP COMPUTLOG AND RAN SPUD BARS & CORE BBL. Ing. Craw: $ -
SET DOWN 9372' - 20' ABOVE IBS - MADE CORE BBL RUNS Daily Total: $ 19,211
AND CLEAN OUT TO TOP OF IBS @ 9392 Cum. Wir: $ 73214
2:00 4:00 2:00 JCIRC. THRU CIRCULATING SUB @ TOP OF FISH & WORK Jcum. Fuael $ 54,885
FISHING STRING Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
4:00 6:00 2:00 JCONTINUE TO CLEAN QUT WITH CORE BBL, MADE 5 MORE FT. FISH
CORE BBL 1S @ BTM. IBS - WHEN WE GET BELOW IBS WE 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
WILL TRY TO BACK OF & COME QUT WITH IT & 6 MORE D.C.  Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
{Shock Sub 61/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.16
J6-61/4"DC | 6174 180.41
TOTAL BHA = 265.97
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 QPR: TRIP IN WITH WASH PIPE Date: 11/05/2004 Days: 40
Depth: 9505 IProg: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $461 TMC: $93,375 TDC: $44,943 |CWC: $1,368,998
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
jMw: 9.4 I# 1aem  6.5X11 [Bit#: 6 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 55 ISPM: Isize: 778" Surf. Csg: $ - {Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 17/13 I# 2a9m  6,5X10 [Type: M-70 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 6124 SPM: IMFG: §TC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 10 GPM : SIN: JT - 6485 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 |Press: Jets: 4/14 - 3/20 Woell Head: $ - {Water: $ -
Solids: 7 AV DC: jin: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuek: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: Out: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
JPH : 9 JetVel: |FTe: 79 Tanks: $ -__|Logging: $ -
lele: 465 JECD IHrs: 4 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 SPR#1: IFPH: 19.8 |Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 |SPR#2: WOB: 10/ 15 IPumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 6 IBtm.Up: |RPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ - |Consuitant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hre:| 359 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 461
6:00 14:30 8:30 JCLEAN FISH TO 9401' - FREE POINT & BACK OFF @ 9397' Misc. / Labor: $ -
RECOVERE6 D.C. &1BS Fishing: $ 29,467
14:30 16:00 1:30 JPUMP OUT 8 JTS. - FISH PULLING FREE Daily Total: $ 44,943
16:00 16:30 0:30 JRIG DOWN COMPUTLOG Cum. Wtr: $ 73214
16:30 0:00 7:30 JTRIP OUT WITH FISH ( CHAINED OUT ) Cum. Fuel $ 54,885
0:00 3:00 3:00 fLAY DOWN FISHING TOOLS & FISH Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
3:00 6:00 3:00 JTRIP IN TO WASH OVER WITH 3 JTS. WASH PIPE BUMPER SUB FISH
JARS, 5§ D.C. & INTENSIFIER 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
[Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
7 7/8" IBS 6 1/4" 5.14
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-61/4"DC | 6 1/4" 30.73
TOTAL BHA = 80.40
Survey
Survey
P/U 0 LITH: BKG GAS
8/0 0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 0 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: MILLING ON IBS Date: 11/06/2004  |Days: 41
Depth: 9505' |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $2,017 TMC: $95,392 TDC: $32,533 |CWC: $1,501,531
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
IMw: 9.4 I# Tasgpm  6.5X11 [Bit#: o] Conductor: $ - |toc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 65 ISPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ -  |Rig Move: $ -
IpviYp: 18/20 I# 2aigm  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 12/24  |SPM: IMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ -  jRental Tools: $ 1,800
WL: 12 JGPM : SIN: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ -___|Trucking: $ -
|cake: 1 |Press: Jets: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: § - |Water: $ -
Solids: 8 AV DC: Jin: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fusl: $ 15501
Sand: Tr AV DP: IOut: |Packers: 3 - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: IFTG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/59 |ECD IHrs: 4 Separator: $ -  |Cement: $ -
Chior: 9000 SPR #1: IFPH: 19.8 |Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR #2 : WOB: 10/15 IPumpIng L/T: 3 - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 57 |Btm.Up: IRPM; 60/55 IPrime Mover; $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:] 359 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2017
6:00 10:30 4:30 |TRIP IN HOLE WITH WASH PIPE Misc. / Labor: $ -
10:30 14:00 3:30 JWASH F/9300' T/9397' - TOP OF FISH Csg. Crew: $ -
14:00 17:30 3:30 |WASH OVER FISH F/9397' T/9441' - TOP OF IBS Daily Total: $ 32,533
17:30 18:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Cum. Wtr: $ 73214
18:00 6:00 12:00 MILL ON IBS Cum. Fuel $ 70,386
Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
WHILE MILLING ON IBS, FISH STARTED TO MOVE FISH
DOWN HOLE F/9441' T/9464' - AFTER GETTING TO 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
9464' WITH WASH OVER SHOE | BELEAVE THE [Mud Motor 6 1/4" 33.11
MOTOR & IBS ARE TURNING WITH THE WASH PIPE |7 7/8" 1BS 61/4" 5.14
AND THE BIT 1S AT OR VERY NEAR BTM. Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
AT REPORT TIME WE ARE GETTING A PILL READY 1-61/4"DC | 61/4" 30.73
TO PUMP AND WE'LL TRIP OUT FOR AN OVERSHOT
TOTAL BHA = 80.40
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S§/10 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455’ TRIP GAS
FUEL  Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

A3-050- 39739
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: TRIP OUT WIT FISH Date: 11/07/2004 Days: 42
Depth: 9505' |Prog: D Hrs: [AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $1,225 T™MC: $96,617 TDC: $16,240 JCWC: $1,517,771
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: 9.4 I# 1esem  6.5X11 [Bit#: 6 Jconductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 65 ISPM: Size: 77/8" ISurf. Csg: $ - {Rig Move: $ -
IPVIYP: 18/20 I# 2490m  6.5X10 [Type: M-70 Ilnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 12/24  [SPM: IMFG: STC lProd Csy: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
wL: 12 GPM : SIN: JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
lCake: 1 JPress: Jots: 4/14 - 3/20 Well Head: $ - |water: 3 -
Solids: 8 AV DC: Pin: 9426 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: Out: |Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: FTG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4159 |ECD IHrs: 4 Iseparator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chior: 9000 ISPR #1: IFPH: 19.8 IHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: WOB: 10/15 IPumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
[Dapp ppb: 57 IBtm.Up: IRPM: 60/ 55 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:] 359 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1225
6:00 7:30 1:30 |MILL ON IBS Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:30 13:30 6:00 JTRIP OUT WITH WASH PIPE Csg. Crew: $ -
13:30 15:30 2:00 |STAND BACK WASH PIPE & PICK UP OVER SHOT Daily Total: $ 16,240
15:30 16:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Cum. Wtr: $ 73214
16:00 21.00 5:00 JTRIP IN HOLE WITH OVER SHOT Cum. Fuel $ 70,386
21:00 21:30 0:30 |BREAK CIRC. & LATCH ON TO FISH |cum. Bits: $ 24,000
21:30 6:00 8:30 JTRIP OUT - CHAINED OUT WET FISH
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
IMud Motor 61/4" 33.11
77/8" 1BS 6 1/4" 514
Shock Sub 6 1/4" 10.42
1-614"DC | 61/4" 30.73
TOTAL BHA = 80.40
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
8/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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Y3-0Y9-3Y 924
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: WASH &REAM TO BTM. Date: 11/08/2004 Days: 43
Depth: 9505 lProg: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $680 TMC: $97,297 TDC: $128,285 JCWC: $1,646,056
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
IMw; 9.5 I# 1asem  6.5X11 [Bit#: 6 7 Conductor: $ - |Lo¢,Cost: $ -
VIS: 50 ISPM: Size: 778" 77/8"  [Surt. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
Ipvivp: 20/14 I# 2419 6.5X10 [Type: M-70 MF-4 Ilnt. Csg: $ - [Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 7127 ISPM: 100  |MFG: 8TC STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
JWL: 14 lGPM : 409 S/N: JT - 6485 | MP 83566 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 1,200
Cake: 1 lPress: 1250  Lets: 4/14 - 3/20 3/18 lWell Head: $ - [water: $ -
Solids: 8 AV DC: 311 in: 9426 9505 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
|Sand: Tr AV DP; 208  Jout: 9505 JPackars: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: IFTG: 79 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 56.4  JECD 9.9 IHrs: 4 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 8000 ISPR #1: IFPH: 19.8 JHeater: $ - {Bits: $ -
{Ca : 120 ISPR #2: WOB: 10/15 IPumpIng ut: % - [Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 58 IBtm.Up: 42 IRPM: 60/55 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 1/X/1 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:] 359 IDain Total: $ - |Dritting Mud: $ 680
6:00 8:00 2:00 |TRIP QUT WITH FISH Misc. / Labor: $ 1,390
8:00 13:30 5:30 JLAY DOWN FISHING TOOLS AND FISH IFishing: $ 110,000
13:30 19:00 5:30 MAGNAFLUX BHA - 2 BAD FACE & 2 CRACKED Daily Total: $ 128,285
19:00 22:00 3:00 JPICK UP 6 D.C. & RAN IN BHA Cum. Wtr: $ 73214
22:00 2:30 4:30 |TRIP IN HOLE TO 9295' ( BROKE CIRC. @ 5400') Cum. Fuel $ 70,386
2:30 4:00 1:30 JLAY DOWN 5 STDS. D.P. OUT OF DERRICK Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
4:00 6:00 2:00 JWASH & REAM F/9295' T/9390' BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
e JUNK BASKE} 6 3/4" 3.13
|eiT sus 6 1/4" 2.99
21 -D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 638.89
Survey
Survey
P/U 215 LITH: BKG GAS
$/0 205 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 210 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR; DRLG. Date: 11/09/2004 Days: 44
Depth: 9515’ lProg: 10 D Hrs: 31/2 |AV ROP: 2.9 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $87 TMC: $97,384 TDC: $25,320 |CWC: $1,671,376
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
IMw- 99 I# Tasem  6.5X11 |Bit#: 7 Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 50 ISPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
[pvive: 20114 I# 2agm  6.5X10 JType: MF-4 int. Csg: 3 - |Day Rate: $ 11,500
Gel: 7127 [sPm: 100 |MFG: STC IProd Csy: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 12.4 GPM : 409  |S/IN: MP 83566 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 718
Cake: 1 JPress: 1250 |Jets: 3/18 Well Head: $ - |water: § -
Solids: 9 AV DC: 311 jin: 9505 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP; 208 Out: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: 3 700
fpH : 9 JotVel: |FTG: 10 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
PHME: 516 JECD 9.9 IHrs: 312 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 8000  JSPR#1: IFPH: 29 Heator: $ - |Bits: $ 7,000
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: WOB: 25 IPumping LT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
{Dapp ppb: 58 IBtm.Up: 42 IRPM: 40 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/B/G: 0/0/0 lMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:] 362 1/2 lDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 87
6:00 15:30 9:30 JREAM & WORK TIGHT HOLE F/9337' T/9461' Misc. / Labor: $ -
15:30 16:30 1:00 JRIG REPAIR ( WORK ON MUD PUMPS ) Csg. Crew: $ -
16:30 18:30 2:00 JREAM & WORK TIGHT HOLE F/9361' T/9495' Daily Total: $ 25320
18:30 21:30 3:00 JRIG REPAIR ( PULLED 7 STDS.OFF BTM.TO WORK ON PUMPS ) jCum. wtr: $ 73214
21:30 2:30 5:00 JREAM & WORK TIGHT HOLE F/9387' T/9505' Cum. Fuel $ 70,386
2:30 6:00 3:30 |DRLG. F/9505' T/9515' 10' 2.9 fph fcum. Bits: $ 24,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
JUNK BASKEL 6 3/4" 3.13
IBIT sUB 6 1/4" 2.99
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 638.89
Survey
Survey
P/U 215 LITH: 50% Shale - 50%Sandstone BKG GAS 10
S/0 205 FLARE: CONN GAS 15
ROT. 200 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET (@ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 220
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date:  11/10/2004 Days: 45
Depth: 9655' lProg: 140 [DHrs: 24 AV ROP: 5.8 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $8,970 TMC: $106,354 TDC: $26,910 JCWC: $1,698,286
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
IMw: 9.9 I# Tasgem 65X11 [IBit#: 7 Conductor: $ - |Loc¢,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 SPM: 90 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
1PVIYP: l14/14 2 A.m;n 6.5X10 T-ype: MF-4 lint. C‘sg: $ - |pay Rat-o: $ 1 1,560
lGeI: 7126 SPM: IMFG: 8TC lProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
lWL: 14 GPM : 405 SIN: MP 83566 |Float Equp: $ - {Trucking: 5 -
Cake: 1 JPress: 1250  Qets: 3718 Well Head: $ - {Water: $ 2925
Isolids: 8 AV DC: 308 i 9505 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: Tr AV DP: 206 Out: JPackers: $ - [Mud Logger: $ 700
|pH : 9 JotVel: 95  |FTG: 150 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ .
IPfIMf: 555 JECD 10.3 IHrs: 27112 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 ISPR #1: IFPH: 5.4 [Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2 : WOB: 45 IPumping LT $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
[Dapp ppb: 56 IBtm.Up: 42  |RPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 383 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 8970
6:00 6:00 24.00 IDRLG, F/9515' T/9655' 140" 5.8 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
Csg. Crow: % -
Daily Total: $ 26,910
Cum, Wtr: $ 76,139
Cum. Fuel $ 70,386
Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
JUNK BASKE] 6 3/4" 3.13
IBIT SUB 6 1/4" 2.99
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 638.89
Survey
Survey
P/U 220 LITH: 60% Shale - 40%Sandstone BKG GAS 30
S$/0 210 FLARE: CONN GAS 45
ROT. 215 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man §.L.Seely PEAK GAS 220




77708 RIBE S30

0
‘5 GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Y3~099-3Y73Y
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 11/11/2004  |Days: 46
Depth: 9832' |Prog: 177 |DHrs: 24 IAV ROP: 7.4 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $809 TMC: $107,163 TDC: $16,424 JCWC: $1,714,710
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 9.9 I# 1asgem  6.5X11 |Bit#: 7 JConductor: $ - ]Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 ISPM: 90 ISize: 778" ISurl‘. Csgy: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
lF;VNP: '14/14 I# 2419m  6.5X10 Ty-pe: | MF-4 - l llnt. Csé: | $ - |Day Ratn-: $ 11.560
Gel: e |sem: JmFG: STC lProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
JwL: 14 GPM : 405 |sIN: MP 83566 IFIoat Equp: $ - __|Trucking: $ 600
Cake: 1 JPross: 1250 Mets: 3/18 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 8 AV DC: 308 fin: 9505 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
{Sand: Tr AV DP: 206  Jout: |Packers: $ ~__ [Mud Logger: $ 700
lPH : 9 JetVel: 95 JF1G: 327 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 555 |ECD : 10.3 IHrs: 51 1/2 1Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChIor: 9000  |SPR#1: IFPH: 6.3 IHoater: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : 120 SPR#2 : WOB: 40 IPumping ut: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
IDapp ppb: 5.6 |Btm.Up: 42 IRPM: 65 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosiorﬁ $ 80
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 383 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 809
6:00 6:00 24:00 |DRLG. F/9655' T/9832' 177" 7.4 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
Csg. Crow: $ -
Daily Total: $ 16,424
Cum. Wtr: $ 76,139
Cum. Fuel $ 70,386
Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
JUNK BASKEE 6 3/4" 3.13
|BIT SUB 6 1/4" 2.99
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 638.89
Survey
Survey
PIU 220 LITH: 20% Shale - 80%Sandstone BKG GAS 50
S/0 210 FLARE: CONN GAS 134
ROT. 215 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 220
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GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: CUT DRILLING LINE Date: 11/12/2004 Days: a7
Depth: 9850 IProg: 18 D Hrs: 3 AV ROP: 6 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $2,215 TMC: $109,378 TDC: $19,032 |CWC: $1,733,742
Contractor: Nabors # 924 MudCo: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 9.9 I# Tasgom  6.5X11 |Bit#: 7 8 RR  [Conductor: $ - |Loe,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 SPM: 90 Siza: 77/8" 77/8" [Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
lpvrye: 14/14 ' Jr2 4.1;--. 6.5X10 ' Type: MF;4 M- 7l0 Ilnt. bsg: $ - |Day liate: $ 11',500
Gel: 7/26 ISPM: IMFG: 8TC 8TC lProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
fwL: 14 IGPM : 405 |SIN: MP 83566 | JT - 6485 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 les: 1250  LJets: 3/18 4/14-3/20 lWell Head: $ - [water: $ -
I1Solids: 8 AV DC: 308 Hm: 9505 9850 ITBG/Rods: $ «  |Fuel: $ -
ISand: Tr AV DP: 206 Jout: 9850 {Packers: $ -__|Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 95 [FTG: 345 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 5/55 JECD : 10.3 IHrs: 54 1/2 Iseparator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chilor: 9000 ISPR #1 IFPH: 6.3 IHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: IWOB: 40 IPumping uT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 5.6 IBtm.Up: 42 IRPM: 70 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: 3 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME jJRot. Hrs:| 362 IDaIIy Total: $ - {Drilling Mud: $ 2215
6:00 9:00 3:00 |DRLG. F/9832' 7/9850' 18' 6 fph Misc. / Labor: $ 1,802
9:00 14:00 5:00 JTRIP OUT FOR BIT Ing. Crew: $ -
14:00 0:00 10:00 IPRESSURE TEST BOPs & CHOKE TO 5000 psi HYDRIL TO 2500 |Daily Total: $ 19,032
( HAD TO CHANGE OUT 1 VALVE ON KILL LINE ) Cum. Wir: $§ 76,139
0:00 4.00 4:00 JTRIP IN WITH PDC BIT & MUD MOTOR Cum. Fuel $ 70,386
4:00 6:00 2:00 |SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
IMud Meotor 61/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
PIU 215 LITH: 20% Shale - 80%Sandstone BKG GAS 50
8/I0 205 FLARE: CONN GAS 134
ROT. 210 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455' TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 220
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Y 3-049— 3Y433Y
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 11/13/2004 Days: 48
Depth: 10209' |Prog: 359 |DHrs: 17 AV ROP; 21.1 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $2,796 TMC: $112,174 TDC: $32,275 |CWC: $1,766,017
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co; M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
mw: 9.9 l# 1asmem  6.5X11 Bit#: 8RR Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 ISPM: 20 ISize: 778" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
I-PVIYP: ' 14/14 VI# 2 m.-.; 6.5X10 'I"ype: M- 76 ' Iint C;g: $ . Day Rat;a: $ 11.500
Get: 7/26  JSPM: JMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - {Rental Tools: $ 1800
Wi 14 GPM : 405 ISIN: JT - 8485 IFIoat Equp: $ - __|Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPress: 1250 Qets: 4/14-3/20 Well Head: $ - |Water: $ -
Solids: 8 AV DC: 308 In: 9850 TBG/Rods; $ - |Fuel: $ 14,464
Sand: Tr AV DP: 206 Out: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IpH : 9 JetVel: 95  [FTG: 359 Tanks: $ - |kogging: $ -
IPfIMf: 555 JECD 10.3 IHrs: 17 }Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 9000 ISPR #: 53@ 410 IFPH: 21.1 IHeater: $ - |Bits: 3 -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: 54 @ 300 jwoB: 15/20 IPumping LT $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
[Dapp ppb: 56 IBtm.Up: 44  IRPM: 65 + 50 lPrime Mover: $ - |corrosion: $ a0
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMlsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 376 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 279
6:00 8:30 2:30 |SLIP & CUT DRILLING LINE Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:30 9:00 0:30 |RIG SERVICE |ng. Crow: $ -
9:00 12:00 3:00 |TRIP IN HOLE ( NO TIGHT HOLE) Daily Total: $ 32,2715
12:00 13:00 1:00 JWASH F/9825' T/9850' (NO FILL) jcum. wir: $ 76139
13:00 6:00 17:00 IDRLG. F/9850' T/10209' 359' 21.1 fph ICum. Fuel $ 84850
Curn. Bits: $ 24,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 61/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U 225 LITH: 20% Shale - 80%Sandstone BKG GAS 80
S/0 220 FLARE: CONN GAS 400
ROT. 220 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS 1620
FUEL  Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 220
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(@B GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: TRIP FOR BIT Date: 11/14/2004 |Days: 49
Depth: 10310 lProg: 101 {D Hrs: 16 IAV ROP: 6.3 Formation: Mesa Verde
DMC: $5,081 T™C: $117,255 TDC: $22,696 JCWC: $1,788,613
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
faw: 10 I# 1asem  B.5X11 |Bit#: 8 RR [Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 ISPM: 90 ISizo: 77/8" Surf. Csq: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
Ipvryp: 15/{ 3 I# 2 41gpm 6‘5x16 Type; M -70 |Ir-|t. Csg: - $ - Da§ Rate: - 3 '1 1,500
Gel: 517 ISPM: IMFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - [Rental Tools: $ 1,900
wL: 12 IGPM : 405 JsiIN: JT - 6485 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
ICako: 1 IPress: 1250 |Jets: 4/14-3/20 IWell Head: $ - |water: $ -
ISoIIds: 10 AV DC: 308 [in: 9850 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 206 IOut: 10310 JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 95 IFTG: 460 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 448  JECD 10.3 IHrs: 33 |Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior: 7000 |spn #1: IFPH: 13.9 leater: $ - |eits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: IWOB: 15/20 IPumping LuT:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
|Dapp ppb: 4.8 IBtm.Up: 44 IRPM: 65 + 50 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:] 375 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 5,081
6:00 8:30 2:30 |DRLG. F/9209' T/10240' 31' 12.4 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:30 9:00 0:30 JSURVEY @ 10190' 3/4 Deg. Csg. Crew: $ -
9:00 12:00 3:00 |DRLG. F/9240' T/10269" 29’ 9.7 fph Daily Total: $ 22,596
12:00 12:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Cum. Wtr: $ 76,139
12:30 23:00 10:30 |DRLG. F/10269' T/10310" 41' 3.9 fph Cum. Fuel $ 84850
23:00 6:00 7:00 |TRIP OUT FOR BIT Cum. Bits: $ 24,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
JMud Mator 6 1/2" 31.59
21 -D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey 3/4 10190’
Survey
PiU 230 LITH: 10% Shale - 30%Sandstone BKG GAS 80
$/0 220 FLARE: CONN GAS 400
ROT. 225 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 D.T. GAS 1470
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 220
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date:  11/15/2004  |Days: 50
Depth: 10401" |Prog: 91 D Hrs: 11 AV ROP: 8.3 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde
DMC: $975 TMC: $118,230 TDC: $25,490 |CWC: $1,814,103
Contractor: Nabors # 924 MudCo: M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
MW: 10 I# 1aspm  6.5X11 EBIt #: 8RR 9 [Conductor: $ - jLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 ISPM: 90 Size: 778" 7 7/8" [Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
| fpvive: 15/13- I# 2419m  6.5X10 [Type: M - 70 HC 468 Z |Int.‘ Csg: | $ - |pay l'?ate: $ 1:|,500
Gel: 517 |SPM: IMFG: STC HTC IProd Csy: $ ~  |Rental Tools: $ 1,800
WL 12 IGPM : 405 |SIN: JT-6485 | 7105650 IFloat Equp: $ -___|Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 IPross: 1250  lets: 4/14-3/20 B/16 IWeII Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 10 AV DC: 308 In: 9850 10310 |TBG/Rods: $ - JFuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 206 JOut: 10310 |Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IpH : 9 JetVal: 89 |FTG: 460 91 Tanks; $ - [Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/48 |ECD : 10.3 lHrs: 33 11 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 7000 |SPR#1: 53 @ 410 IFPH: 13.9 83 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ 7,000
jca : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 300 IWOB: 15720 15/20 IPumpin_q ur: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
IDapp ppb: 4.8 ]|Btm.Up: 44 IRPM: 65+ 50 65 + 65 IPrime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 6/X/1 |Mlsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 370 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 976
6:00 7:00 1:00 |TRIP OUT FOR BIT ( NO TIGHT HOLE ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:00 7:30 0:30 JCHANGE BIT Csg. Crew: $ -
7:30 8:00 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Daily Total: $ 25,490
8:00 10:30 2:30 JTRIP IN TO CSG. SHOE Cum. Wir: $ 76,139
10:30 14:30 4:00 JRIG REPAIR ( COMPOUND CHAIN & AIR LINE TO LOW CLUTCH ) JCum. Fuel $ 84,850
14:30 18:30 4:00 ITRIP IN ( NO TIGHT HOLE) Cum. Bits: $ 31,000
18:30 19:00 0:30 |JWASH 30' TO BTM. - NO FILL BHA
19:00 6:00 11:00 |DRLG. F/10310' T/10401' 91' 8.3 fph 7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U 230 LITH: 40% Shale - 60%Sandstone BKG GAS 80
$/0 220 FLARE: CONN GAS 400
ROT. 225 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS 5500
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 220
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 11/16/2004  |Days: 51
Depth: 10414 lProg: 13 D Hrs: 51/2 |AV ROP: 2.4 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde
DMC: $2,586 TMC: $120,816 TDC: $27,738 JCWC: $1,841,841
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co; M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 10 I# Tasgom  6.5X11 |Bit#: 9 10 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 43 SPM: 90 [Size: 7 7/8" 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
* Ipvive: 1513 [#20mm  65%10 |rype: | HC4087 | MF45H fintcsg: 5 - |payRate: $ 11,500
IGeI: 517 ISPM: IMFG: HTC STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,800
WL: 12 GPM 405 lSIN: 7105650 MW2596 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 637
[Cake: 1. hPress: 1260 QJets: 8/16 3/22 [Well Head: $ - |Water: $ -
Solids: 10 AV DC: 308 [in: 10310 10406  |TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 206 Out: 10406 |Packers: $ - [Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 95 JFTG: 96 8 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/48  JECD 10.3 IHrs: 14 21/2  |Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChIor: 7000 ISPR #1: IFPH: 6.9 32 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ 7,000
ICa : 120 ISPR #2: FNOB: 15/20 15/20 {PumpingLiT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
IDapp ppb: 4.8 IBtm.Up: 44 IRPM: 65 + 55 65 + 55 IPrimo Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME [Rot. Hrs:| 364 1/2 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2,586
6:00 9:00 3:00 JDRLG. F/10401' T/10406' 5' 1.7 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:00 10:00 1:00 JPUMP PILL ( TRIP FOR MOTOR) Csg. Crew: $ -
10:00 12:00 2:00 FTRIP OUT ( NO TIGHT HOLE) Daily Total: $ 27,738
12:00 13:30 1:30 JRIG REPAIR ( COMPOUND CHAIN ) Cum. Wtr: $ 76,139
13:30 16:30 3:00 JTRIP OUT Cum. Fuel $ 84,850
16:30 19:00 2:30 |CHANGE MUD MOTOR & BIT Cum. Bits: $ 38,000
19:00 21:00 2:00 JRIG REPAIR ( CHANGE BRAKE QUT LINES ) BHA
21:00 3:30 6:30 |TRIP IN HOLE 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
3:30 6:00 2:30 |DRLG. F/10406' T/10414' &' 3.2 fph [Mud Motor 61/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U 230 LITH: 40% Shale - 60%Sandstone BKG GAS 80
S5/0 220 FLARE: CONN GAS 400
ROT. 225 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET 3455 TRIP GAS 800
FUEL, Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 220
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

TI08 RICE S0
43047~ 3¢9y

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 11/17/2004 Days: 52
Depth: 580" |Prog: 166 [DHrs: 23172 |AV ROP: 7.1 Formation: lL.ower Mesa Verde
DMC: $1,626 TMC: $122,442 TDC: $19,859 |CWC: $1,861,700
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
MW-: 10.1 I# T4s0m  6.5X11 [Bit#: 10 Conductor: 3 - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 ISPM: 90 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csq: $ - IRig Move: $ -
[pPvive: - 18/16 - #2a000m  6.5X10 'I.'ypo: ' MF 45VH ilnt C‘sg: 3 - l Day Rat‘e: $ 11,500
Gel: 817  JsPM: ImFa: STC IProd Csy: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 11 GPM : 405 Ism: MW2596 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 718
Cake: 1 JPross: 1250 Rets: 3/22 lWeII Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 10 AV DC: 308 in; 10406 TBG/Rods: $ - {Fuel: $ -
ISand: 1 AV DP: 206 Out: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVal: 95  |FTG: 174 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/48  |ECD 10.3 IHrs: 26 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 7000 JSPR#: 53 @ 410 IFPH: 67 |Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 300 IWOB: 45 IPumping ur:  $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
[Dapp ppb: 52 §Btm.Up: 45 RPM: 45 + 56 |Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME fRot. Hrs: 388 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1626
6:00 10:00 4:00 |DRLG. F/10414' T/10428' 14' 3.5 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
10:00 10:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
10:30 6:00 19:30 |DRLG. F/10428' T/10580' 152' 7.8 fph Daily Total: $ 19,859
Cum. Wtr: $ 76,139
Cum. Fuel $ 84,850
Cum. Bits: $ 38,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
jMud Motor 61/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4* 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
PV 230 LITH: 10% Shale - 90%Sandstone BKG GAS 80
$/0 220 FLARE: CONN GAS 120
ROT. 225 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET (@ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 220
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 11/18/2004 Days: 53
Depth: 10750' |Prog: 170 |D Hrs: 23 1/2 IAV ROP: 7.2 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde
DMC:. $1,166 TMC: $123,608 TDC: $39,051 JCWC: $1,900,751
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co:. M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 10.2 l# Tisgm  6.5X11 IBit#: 10 Conductor: $ - |Log,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: 90 [size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
fpviye: 16/16 i# 2 419pm | 6.5X10 Ty|:;e: MF 45 H. ‘|Int. ng; - $ - 6ay Rate: - $ 11,506
lce: 817  |sPm: |mFG: STC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 11 GPM : 405 SIN: MW2596 lFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: 3 -
Cake: 1 |Press: 1250 Qets: 3722 Well Head: $ - |water: $ 6,030
Solids; 1 AV DC: 308  fin: 10406 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ 14,340
Sand: 1 AV DP: 206 IOut: jPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
|PH : 9 JetVel: 95 [FTG: 344 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPf/Mf: 45  JECD 10.3  |Hrs: 49112 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 6000 IéPR #1: 53@ 410 IFPH: 6.9 [Heater: $ - |[Blts: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 300 |WOB: 45 PumpingLT: _ § - {Mud Motors: $ 2,500
|Dapp ppb: 48 |Btm.Up: 45 IRPM: 45 + 56 JPrime Mover: % - Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot Hrs:] 411 1/2 IDain Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,166
6:00 12:00 6:00 JDRLG. F/10580' T/10617" 37" 6.1 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
1200 | 12:30 | 0:30 |RIG SERVICE [osg. crow: $ :
12:30 6:00 17:30 |DRLG. F/10617' T/10750" 133" 7.6 fph Daily Total: $ 39,051
Cum. Wtr: $ 82169
Cum. Fuel $ 99,190
Cum. Bits: $ 38,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
IMud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U 235 LITH: 5% Shale - 95%Sandstone BKG GAS 150
S$/0 225 FLARE: CONN GAS 300
ROT. 230 LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" SET (@ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: WASHING TO BTM. @ 10700' Date: 11/19/2004 Days: 54
Depth: 10775 lProg: 25 D Hrs: 41/2 |AV ROP: 5.6 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde
DMC: $2,441 TMC: $126,049 TDC: $19,956 |CWC: $1,920,707
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: 10.2 I# 1asem  6.5X11 [Bit#: 10 11 IConductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: 90 Size: 77/8" 77/18" [Surf. Csg: $ - {Rig Move: $ -
IpviYp: 18)16 |#-2 argpm  6.5X10 Typé: MF 45H Déx 145 fint, ng:- $ - D;y Rate: - $ ‘ 11,500'
Gel: 817 ISPM: IMFG: STC HYC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,900
jwL: 11 GPM : 405  |SIN: MW2596 507182 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPross: 1250 Jets: 3/22 3/14 - 3/18 [Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 10 AV DC: 308 pim: 10406 10775 |TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 206 Jout 10775 Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JotVel: 95  [FTG: 369 Tanks: $ - JLogging: $ -
IPfIMf: 448 |eco 10.3 IHrs: 54 [Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 7000 SPR#1: 53 @410 IFPH: 6.8 IHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 |SPR#2: 54 @ 300 IWOB: 45 |Pumplng ur: % - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
[Dapp ppb: 52 lBtm.Up: 45 IRPM: 45 + 56 45 + 56 IPrIme Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 5/FI11 IMisc: $ - |Consuitant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 416 IDally Total: $ -~ |Drilling Mud: $ 244
6:00 10:30 4:30 IDRLG. F/10750' T/10775' 25' 5.6 fph Misc. / Labor: 3 -
10:30 11:00 0:30 MIX & PUMP PILL Csg. Crew: $ -
11:00 18:00 7:00 |TRIP OUT FOR BIT ( NO TIGHT HOLE ) Daily Total: $§ 19,956
18:00 20:00 2:00 JCHANGE BIT & MOTOR AND REPAIR ROT.HEAD Cum. Wtr: $ 82,169
20:00 3:00 7:00 JTRIP IN HOLE TO 10700' Cum. Fuel $ 99,190
3:00 6:00 3:00 |WORK TIGHT HOLE AT BIT - HAD SOMETHING BESIDE BIT THAT|Cum. Bits: $ 38,000
WAS STALLING MOTOR - STRING WAS FREE AND WOULD ROT. BHA
WITHOUT TORQUE - LAID DOWN 2 JTS. AND WE ARE WASHINGJ7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
BACK TO BTM. @ 10700 [Mud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U 235 LITH: 5% Shale - 95%Sandstone BKG GAS
S/0 225 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 230 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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Y 3~p49- 39734
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: RIG REPAIR Date: 11/20/2004 Days: 55
Depth: 10785' |Prog: 10 D Hrs: 1 IAV ROP: 10 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde
DMC: TMC: $126,049 TDC: $16,015 |CWC: $1,936,722
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co. M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
jmw: 10.3 I# 1asom  6.5X11 |Bit#: 11 Conductor: $ - |Log¢,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: 20 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
IPVIYP: 18/16 [#2410em  6.5X10 [Type: DSX 145 Jint. Csq: 3 -  |Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: 8/17 SPM: IMFG: HYC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,800
WL; 11 GPM : 405 SN 507182 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPress: 1250  Mets: 3/14 - 3118 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 10 AV DC: 308 fim: 10775 TBG/Rods: $ - Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 206 Qut: [Packers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
|PH : 9 JetVel: 95  JFTG: 10 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/48 |ECD 10.3 IHrs: 1 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chlor: 7000  JSPR#1: 53 @ 410 IFPH: 10 JHeator: $ - [IBits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 300 |WOB: 10 PumpingL/T:  $ - |Mud Motors: 3 -
|Dapp ppb: 52 Btm.Up: 45 IRPM: 45 + 56 JPrime Mover: 3 - Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down; T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME [Rot. Hrs: IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ -
6:00 6:30 0:30 JWASH F/10700' T/10775' Misc. / Labor: $ -
6:30 7:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
7:00 8:00 1:00 |DRLG. F/10775' T/10785' Daily Total: $ 16,015
8:00 9:00 1:00 JCIRC. & COND. FOR TRIP QUT TQ CSG.SHOE TO WORK ON RIG jcum. wtr: $ 82169
9:00 13:30 4:30 |TRIP OUT TO 3500' { NO TIGHT HOLE ) Cum. Fuel $ 99190
13:30 6:00 16:30 |RIG REPAIR ROT.DRIVE & # 2 MOTOR CLUTCH Cum. Bits: $ 38,000
WAITING ON PARTS BHA
7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
Mud Motor 61/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: 20% Shale - 80%Sandstone BKG GAS
§/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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Y3090~ BY 77Y
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: RIG REPAIR Date: 11/21/2004 Days: 56
Depth: 10785 |Prog: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation: Lower Mesa Verde
DMC: TMC: $126,049 TDC: $16,015 JCWC: $1,952,737

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 10.1 I# Tasem  6.5X11 |Bit #: 11 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: 90 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
Ipvivp: 18/16  J# 24190  6.5X10 [Type: DSX 145 lint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 12500
Gel: 817 SPM: MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 11 GPM : 405 SIN: 507182 {Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 {Pross: 1250 JJets: 3/14 - 3/18 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 10 AV DC; 308  fjin: 10775 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 206 Jout: IPackers: $ - {Mud Logger: $ 700
|PH : 9 JetVel: 95  JFTG: 10 Tanks: $ - |Logging: 3 -
IPfle: 4/48 |ECD 10.3 IHrs: 1 Separator: $ - Cement: $ -
Chior: 7000 SPR#1: 53 @410 IFPH: 10 JHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 300 JWOB: 10 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: 3 -
|Dapp ppb: 52 Btm.Up: 45 IRPM: 45 + 56 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: 3 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 [Misc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 416 Daily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ -
6:00 6:00 24:00 |RIG REPAIR - WAIT ON PARTS FOR ROT. DRIVE Misc. / Labor: 3 -
Csg. Crew: 3 -
Daily Total: $ 16,015
Cum. Wtr: $ 82169
Cum. Fuel $ 99,190
Gum. Bits: $ 38,000

BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
{Mud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 61/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: TRIP IN HOLE Date: 11/22/2004 Days: 57
Depth: 10785’ IProg: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation: Lower Mesa Verde
DMC: TMC: $126,049 TDC: $18,765 |CWC: $1,971,502
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 10.1 I# Tasgem  65X11 |Bit# 11 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: a0 Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
IPVIYP: 18/16  #2a19em  6.5X10 [Type: DSX 145 fint. Csg: $ - Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: 8/17 SPM: MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL : 11 GPM : 405 SIN: 507182 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 510
Cake: 1 JPross: 1250 |Jets: 3/14 - 3/18 Well Head: $ - Iwater: 3 -
Solids: 10 AV DC: 308 | 10775 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 206 Qut: Packers: $ - [Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 95  |FTG: 10 Tanks: $ - lLogging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/48  JECD 10.3 IHrs: 1 Separator: $ - |Cement: 3 -
Chior: 7000 ISPR #1: 53@ 410 IFPH: 10 [Heater: $ - |Bits: 3 -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: 54 @ 300 JWoB: 10 Pumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
|Dapp ppb: 52 IBtm.Up: 45 IRPM: 45 + 56 jPrime Mover: % - Corrosion: % 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 lMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 416 Daily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ -
6:00 4.00 22:00 JRIG REPAIR ( ROT. DRIVE SHAFT & BEARINGS ) Misc. / Labor: § 2240
4:00 6:00 2:00 |TRIP IN HOLE TO DRILL Csg. Craw: $ -
Daily Total: $ 18,765
Cum. Wtr: $ 82,169
Cum. Fuel $ 99,180
Cum. Bits: $ 38,000
BHA
7 718" Bit 77/8" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 8 5/8" 3455’ TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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H43~04)- 34534
FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 11/23/2004  |Days: 58
Depth: 11092' IProg: 307 [DHrs: 211/2 IAV ROP: 14.3 Formation: Castiegate
DMC: $2,933 TMC: $128,982 TDC: $24,327 |CWC: $1,995,829
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
mw: 10.1 I# Tasgom  6.5X11 [Bit#: 11 Conductor: 3 - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 ISPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: 3 - |Rig Move: $ -
IPVIYP; 18/16 I# 2ugom  6.5X10 [Type: DSX 145 Jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: an7 SPM: 103 MFG: HYC IProd Csg: % 2,161 |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 11 GPM : 422 SIN; 507182 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: 3 718
Cake: 1 |Press: 1700  jJets: 3/14 - 3/18 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 10 AV DC: 320 [Iin: 10775 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel 3 -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 215 Jout: JPackers: $ - [Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH ; 9 JetVel: 113  {FTG: 317 Tanks: $ - |[Logging: $ -
|PfIMf: 4148 |ECD 10.4 IHrs: 22 1/2 Separator: 3 - |Cement: $ -
[Chlor: 5000 SPR#1: 53 @410 IFPH: 14.1 |Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
ICa : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 300 |WOB: 15/25 IPumping UT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: 4.8 |Btm.Up: 47 IRPM: 45 + 56 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 Imisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 437 1/2 IDain Total: $ 2,161 |Drilling Mud: $ 2933
6:00 7:30 1:30 JTRIP IH HOLE TO 10733' Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:30 8:00 0:30 JWASH F/10733' (NO FILL) Csg. Crew: $ -
8:00 13:00 5:00 |DRLG. F/10785' T/10899" 114" 22.8 fph Daily Total: $ 22,166
13:00 13:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE jCum. wtr: $ 82,169
13:30 6:00 16:30 |DRLG. F/10899' T/11092' 193" 11.7 fph Cum. Fuel $ 99190
Cum. Bits: $ 38,000
BHA
MUD LOGGER THINKS CASTLEGATE TOP IS AT 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
11,083 JMud Motor 61/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U 240 LITH: 50% Shale - 50%Sandstone BKG GAS 400
S/0 230 FLARE: CONN GAS 1000
ROT. 235 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS 3620
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man 5.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: TRIP IN Date:  11/24/2004  |Days: 59
Depth: 11148 lProg: 56 D Hrs: 11 lAV ROP: 51 Formation: Castlegate
DMC: $2,860 TMC: $131,842 TDC: $32,485 JCWC: $2,028,314
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
jmw: 10.1 I# 1480om  6.5X11 |Bit#: 11 12 Conductor: $ - |toc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: 90 Size: 77/8" 77/8" J5urf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: 3 -
IPviYp: 13112 [#24m  6.5X10 |Type: DSX 145 F57Y [int Csg: $ - |Day Rate; $ 12,500
Gel: 5116 SPM: IMFG: HYC STC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,800
jwL: 12 GPM : 405 S/N: 507182 MT 7366 IFloat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 |Press: 1250 [Jets: 3/14 - 3/18 3/22 |Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 9 AV DC: 308  [in: 10775 11148 |TBGI/Rods: 3 - |Fuel $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP; 206 Jout: 11148 [packers; $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
|pH 9 Jetvel: 95 JFTG: 373 Tanks: $ - ___|Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: .5/5.2 |ECD 10.3  JHrs: 34 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 7000 SPR#1: 53 @ 410 JFPH: 11 |Heater: $ - |Bits: $ 8,000
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 300 JWOB: 15725 Pumping LIT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
{Dapp ppb: 4.9 |Btm.Up: 48 IRPM; 45+ 56 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 8/X/1 Misc: 3 - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 448 1/2 IDaIIy Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 2860
6:00 11:00 5:00 |DRLG. F/11092' T/11117' 25' 5 fph Misc. / Labor: $ 3110
11:00 11:30 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
11:30 18:00 6:30 [DRLG. F/11117° T/11148" 31" 4.8 fph Daily Total: $ 32,485
18:00 18:30 0:30 JPUMP PILL Cum. Wtr: $ 82,169
18:30 1:30 7:00 JTRIP OUT FOR BIT ( NO TIGHT HOLE ) jCum. Fuel $ 89,190
1:30 2:30 1:00 |CHANGE BIT Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
2:30 6:00 3:30 JTRIP IN HOLE BHA
7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
JMud Motor 61/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
PIU 245 LITH: 20% Shale - 80%Sandstone BKG GAS 200
S10 235 FLARE: CONN GAS 400
ROT. 240 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 11/25/2004  |Days: 60
Depth: 11290 lProg: 142 [DHrs: 20 1/2 IAV ROP: 6.9 Formation: Blackhawk
DMC: $1,571 T™MC: $133,413 TDC: $35,165 [CWC: $2,063,479
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Mw: 10.1 I# 1asem  6.5X11 |Bit#: 12 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM; Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
|PVIYP: 15/12 #2419m  6.5X10 |Type: F57Y Int. Csg: $ Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: 6/21 ISPM: 103  [MFG: STC |Prod Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 1,800
WL: 12 GPM 422 SIN: MT 7366 Float Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 Press: 1700  LJets: 37122 [well Head: $ Water: $ 504
Solids: 9 AV DC: 320  fin: 11148 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ 14575
Isand: 1 AV DP: 215  Jout: Packers: $ Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 113 JFTG: 142 Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
,PfIMf: 5/54  JECD 10.4 IHrs: 20 1/2 Separator: $ Cement: $ -
Chior: 6000 _ |SPR#1: 53 @ 500 - 6.9 |Heator: $ Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 450 JWOB: 35/45 IPumping_ ur: % Mud Motors: $ 2,500
|Dapp ppb: 5.2 |Btm.Up: 48  |RPM: 45 + 56 IPrIme Mover: $ Corrosion; $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs:| 469 Daily Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ 1,571
6:00 8:30 2:30 |TRIP IN HOLE WITH BIT # 12 ( NO TIGHT HOLE ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:30 9:00 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Csg. Crew: $ -
9:00 9:30 0:30 |WASH 42' TO BTM. (NOFILL) Daily Total: $ 35,165
9:30 6:00 20:30 |IDRLG. F/11148' T/11290" 142' 6.9 fph Cum. Wtr: $ 82673
Cum. Fuel $ 113,765
Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
IMud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21 - D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U 250 LITH: 10% Shale - 90%Sandstone BKG GAS 300
$/0 230 FLARE: CONN GAS 800
ROT. 240 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS 1420
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: TRIP IN HOLE Date: 11/26/2004 Days: 61
Depth: 11297 IProg: 7 D Hrs: 2 IAV ROP: 3.5 Formation: Blackhawk
DMC; $1,567 T™C: $134,980 TDC: $20,082 JCWC: $2,083,561
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: 10.1 |# 1asgpm  6.5X11 |Bit#: 12 13 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM; Size; 778" 77/8" |Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 15112  [#240m  6.5X10 [Type: Fo7Y DSX 199 fint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: 6/21 SPM: 103 |MFG: STC HYC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Toots: $ 1,900
fwL: 12 GPM 422 SIN: MT 7366 107113 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: 3 -
Cake: 1 JPress: 1700  QJets: 3/22 3/14 3/18 IWe:ll Head: $ - |Water: 3 -
Solids: 9 AV DC: 320 Jin: 11148 11297 |TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 215 Out: 11297 JPackers: $ - [Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 113 JFTG: 149 Tanks: $ - __|Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 554  |ECD 10.4 IHrs: 22 1/2 Iseparator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chilor: 6000 ISPR #1: 53 @ 500 IFPH: 6.8 Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: 54 @ 450 JWOB: 45 + 56 Pumping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
|Dapp ppb: 52 IBtm.Up: 49 IRPM: 45 + 56 jPrime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 4/E/] IMisc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME |Rot. Hrs:} 471 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 1567
6:00 8:00 2:00 IDRLG. F/11290' T/11297' 7' 3.5 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
8:00 8:30 0:30 JPUMP PILL & DROP SURVEY Csg. Crew: $ -
8:30 19:30 11:00 JTRIP OUT FOR BIT ( NO TIGHT HOLE ) Daily Total: $ 20,082
19:30 20:30 1:00 JCHANGE BIT & MUD MOTOR Cum. Wtr: $ 82873
20:30 21:00 0:30 JRIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 113,765
21:00 0:00 3:00 |TRIP IN HOLE TO CSG. SHOE Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
0:00 6:00 6.00 [SHUT DOWN & WAIT ON DAYLIGHT BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
SHORT HANDED NIGHT CREW WALKED OFF JMud Motor 61/2" 31.59
WORKING WITH ONE CREW - STARTED IN HOLE 21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
AT 6:00 AM
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey 13/4 11267
Survey
P/U 250 LITH: 10% Shale - 90%Sandstone BKG GAS
810 230 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 240 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 11/27/2004 Days: 62
Depth: 11468’ |Prog: 171 D Hrs: 17 AV ROP; 10.1 Formation: Blackhawk
DMC: $239 TMC: $135,219 TDC: $21,491 JCWC: $2,105,052
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
IMw: 10.1 I# Tasgem  6.5X11 IBit#: 13 Conductor: $ -~ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
Jpvive: 15112 [#29em  6.5X10 [Type: DSX 199 Int. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: 621  |SPM: 103  MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 12 IcPM : 422 ISIN: 107113 Float Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 IPross: 1900  fJets: 3/14 3/18 Well Head; $ - |water: $ 2,737
Solids: 10 AV DC: 320 Qin: 11297 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 215 IOut: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
IpH : 9 JotVel: 113 IFTG: 171 Tanks: $ - |Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: A4/58 JECD 10.4 IHrs: 17 Separator: $ - |Cement: 3 -
Chlor: 5000 SPR#1: 53 @ 500 [FPH: 10.1 |Heater: $ - |pits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 450 [WOB: 16/25 IPumping UT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
|Dapp ppb: 55 |Btm.Up: 49 RPM: 45 + 56 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ a0
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 |Misc: $ - |Consuitant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 488 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 239
6:00 12:00 6:00 JTRIP IN HOLE - BREAK CIRC. @ 8000' ( NO TIGHT HOLE ) Misc. / Labor: $ -
12:00 13:00 1:00 JWASH 30' TO BTM. ( NO FILL ) 'ng. Craw: $ -
13:00 6:00 17:00 |DRLG. F/11297' T/11468' 171" 10.1 fph Daily Total: $ 21,49
Cum. Wtr: $ 85410
DRILLING SHORT HANDED - WE HAVE TWO HANDS  JCum. Fuel $ 113,765
ON DAYS AND TWO HANDS ON NIGHTS - HOPING Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
NABORS CAN COME UP WITH ANOTHER CREW BHA
THIS WEEKEND 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U 250 LITH: 40% Shale - 60%Sandstone BKG GAS 300
$/0 230 FLARE: CONN GAS 600
ROT. 240 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS 840
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 11/30/2004 Days: 65
Depth: 11695’ |Prog: 91 D Hrs: 6 IAV ROP: 15.2 Formation: Blackhawk
DMC: TMC: $139,653 TDC: $19,233 |CWC: $2,166,424
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
fmw: 104 #1esem  6.5X11 [Bit#: 13 14 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 45 SPM: Size: 77/8" 77/8"  |Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
fpvive: 1512 J#2410m  6.5X10 |Type: DSX 198 | HC 506 Z jint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gol: 6/21 SPM: 103  MFG: HYC HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,800
WL: 12 GPM : 422 SIN: 107113 7105015 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ 718
Cake: 1 [Press: 1800  Qets: 3/14 3/18 6 X 15 IWoII Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 9 AV DC: 320 fjin: 11297 11604 ]TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 215 Qut: 11604 JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
|PH : 9 JotVel: 113 JFTG: 307 91 Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 5i5.4  |ECD 10.4 IHrs: 47 6 [Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chior: 8000 JSPR#1: 53 @ 500 IFPH: 6.5 15.2 IHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 450 IWOB: 15/ 25, 15-Oct IPumping ur: % - {Mud Motors: $ 2500
[Dapp ppb: 52 |Btm.Up: 49 IRPM: 45 + 56 45 + 56 |Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 8/X/ 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - |Consuitant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 518 524 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ -
6:00 10:00 4:00 JTRIP OUT Misc. / Labor: $ -
10:00 11:00 1:00 JCHANGE MUD MOTOR & BIT Csg. Crew: $ -
11:00 14:00 3:00 |TRIP IN TO 3500' Daily Total: $ 19,233
14:00 17:30 3:30 JSLIP AND CUT DRILLING LINE Cum. Wtr: $ 85410
17:30 23:00 5:30 |TRIP IN HOLE ( NO TIGHT HOLE ) Cum. Fuel $ 113,765
23:00 0:00 1:.00 |BREAK CIRC. AND WASH 35' TO BTM.- NO FILL Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
0:00 6:00 6:00 [DRLG. F/11604' T/11695' 91' 15.2 fph BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
IMud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/l 255 LITH: 20% Shale - 80%Sandstone BKG GAS 300
SI0 240 FLARE: CONN GAS 400
ROT. 248 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS 1400
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 12/01/2004 Days: 66
Depth: 12025 IProg: 330 |DHrs: 20 lAV ROP: 16.6 Formation: Spring Canyon
DMC: $479 TMC: $140,132 TDC: $21,919 JCWC: $2,188,343
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
MW: 10.7 |# 1asgem  6.5X11 |Bit#: 14 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS; 45 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csy: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
PVIYP: 17115 #2410 6.5X10 |Type: HC 506 Z Jint. Csy: $ - |Ppay Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: 824  |sPm: 103  |MFG: HTC |Prod Csy: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 12 IcPM : 422  |sIN: 7105015 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 lPress: 1900 Jets: 6X15 Well Head: $ - |water $ 2925
Solids: 14 AV DC: 320 Jin: 11604 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP; 215 IOut: [Packers: $ - [Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 113 JFTG: 421 Tanks: $ - __|Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/56 |ECD 10.4  |Hrs: 26 |Separator: $ - |cement: $ -
Chlor. 6000 |SPR#1: 53 @ 500 |FPH: 16.2 IHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 |sPR#2: 54 @ 450 JWOB: 15/20 IPumpin_g_ LT:  $ - ___{Mud Motors: $ 2500
{Dapp ppb: 5.3 |Btm.Up: 51 IRPM: 45 + 56 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ g0
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 Misc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 544 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 479
6:00 0:00 18:00 |DRLG. F/11695' T/11981' 286" 15.9 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
0:00 4:00 4:00 |CIRC. OUT GAS AND INC. MUD WT. F/10.3ppg T/10.7ppg Csg. Crew: $ -
4:00 6:00 2:00 |DRLG. F/11981' T/12025' 44' 22 fph Daily Total: $ 21,919
Cum. Wir: $§ 88,335
Cum. Fuel $ 113,765
Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
JMud Motor 6 172" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/J 255 LITH: 50% Shale - 256% Sandstone - 25% Siltstone BKG GAS 500
S/0 240 FLARE: CONN GAS 1640
ROT. 248 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man 8.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: CIRC. & COND. MUD Date: 12/02/2004 Days: 67
Depth: 12025' [Prog: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation: Spring Canyon
DMC: $10,435 TMC: $150,567 TDC: $35,886 JCWC: $2,224,229
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co; M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
MW: 11.4 I# 1usm  6.5X11 |Bit#: 14 Conductor: $ - |Loe,Cost: $ -
VIS: 46 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
levive: 17/15  [#2a19em  6.5X10 [Type: HC 506 Z Iint. csg: $ - |Day Rate; $ 12,500
Gel: 924 SPM: 103  |MFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 12 GPM : 422 ISIN: 7105015 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPress: 1900 Pets: 6X15 |Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 14 AV DC: 320 |in: 11604 TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel: $ 6936
Sand: 0.5 AV DP: 215 Jout: JPackers: $ - |Mud Logger: $ 700
JPH : 9 JetVel: 113 JFTG: 421 Tanks: $ - [Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/45 |ECD 10.4 IHrs: 26 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
IChIor: 7000 ISPR#1: 53 @ 500 IFPH: 16.2 |Heater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 SPR#2: 54 @ 450 IWOB: 15/20 IPumping LuT: $ - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
IDapp ppb: 4.5 JBtm.Up: 49 IRPM: 45 + 56 IPrimo Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 lMIsc: $ - |Consuitant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 544 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 10435
6:00 11:30 5:30 JCIRC.THRU CHOKE - BUILD VOL.& INC. MUD WT. TO 11 ppg Misc. / Labor: $ -
11:30 19:30 8:00 JREAPIR FLOW LINE VALVES & THAW OUT GAS BUSTER LINES |csg. Crew: $ -
INC. MUD WT. TO 11.5 ppg Daily Total: $ 35,886
19:30 6:00 10:30 JCIRC. OUT GAS THRU CHOKE WITH 11.5 ppg MUD Cum. Wtr: $ 88,335
Cum. Fuel $ 120,701
AT REPORT TIME TOOK WELL OFF CHOKE AND Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
WENT BACK TO DRILLING BHA
7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
IMud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U 255 LITH: 50% Shale - 25% Sandstone - 25% Siltstone BKG GAS 600
8/0 240 FLARE: 5'-30 CONN GAS
ROT. 248 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET (@ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 1650
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: DRLG. Date: 12/03/2004  |Days: 68
Depth: 12125 IProg: 100  |D Hrs: 17 1/2 IAV ROP: 5.7 Formation: Spring Canyon
DMC: $18,438 TMC: $169,005 TDC: $36,953 [CWC: $2,261,182
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
MW 116 I# 14spm  5.5X11 [Bit#: 14 Conductor: $ - jLoc,Cost: 3 -
VIS: 53 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
feviye: 19111 [#2a15m  6.5X10 [Type: HC 506 Z Iint. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: 5/16 SPM: 103 iMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,800
JwL: 12 GPM : 422 S/N: 7105015 IFIoat Equp: $ - [Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPress: 2000 |Jets: 6 X 15 Well Head: $ - [Water: $ -
Solids: 16 AV DC: 320 fin: 11604 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 215 lOut: [Packers: $ - {Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 113 IFTG: 521 Tanks: $ - lLogging: $ -
IPfIMf: 445 JECD 10.4 IHrs: 43 1/2 Iseparator: $ - {Cement: $ -
Chior: 7000 lSPR #: 53@600 IFPH: 12 IHeatar: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: 54 @ 550 Iwoa: 15/ 20 IPumping ut: % - |Mud Motors: $ 2500
[Dapp ppb: 44 IBtm.Up: 51 IRPM: 45 + 56 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIRIG: 0/0/0 lMIsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME Jrot. Hrs:|  561.5 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ 18,438
6:00 7:00 1:00 JTOOK WELL OFF CHOKE & WASH 30' TO BMT. Misc. / Labor: $ -
7:00 11:00 4:00 [DRLG. F/12025' T/12050' 25' 6.25 fph Ing. Crow: $ -
11:00 16:00 5:00 JRIG REPAIR WORK FLOOR MOTORS Daily Total: $ 36,953
16:00 21:00 5:00 |DRLG. F/12050' T/12080" 30" 6.0 fph [Cum. wtr: $ 88,335
21:00 21:30 0:30 |RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 120,701
21:30 6:00 8:30 |DRLG. F/12080"' T/12125' 45' 5.3 fph Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
BHA
7 7/8" Bit 7 7/8" 1.00
Mud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U 250 LITH: BKG GAS 100
S§/0 240 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 245 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 D.T. GAS 1600
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS 1640
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FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: RIG DOWN LOGGERS Date: 12/04/2004 Days: 69
Depth: 12200’ IProg: 75 D Hrs: 31/2 |AV ROP: 21.4 Formation: Spring Canyon
DMC: $2,530 TMC: $171,535 TDC: $21,045 JCWC: $2,282,227
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
mw: 119 I# 1aspm  6.5X11 |Bit#: 14 Conductor: $ Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 53 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf. Csg: $ Rig Move: $ -
|PVIYP; 19/11 ¥ 24190m  6.5X10 [Type: HC 506 Z Jint. Csg: 3 Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: 5/16 SPM: 103 MFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ Rental Tools: $ 1,900
WL: 12 GPM : 422  |SIN: 7105015 IFIoat Equp: $ Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPross: 2000 Hets: 6X15 lWeII Head: 3 Water: $ -
Solids: 16 AV DC: 320 {in: 11604 TBG/Rods: $ Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: 215 JOut: JPackers: $ Mud Logger: $ 700
{PH : 9 JotVel: 113  |FTG: Tanks: $ Logging: $ -
lele: 4/45 |ECD 10.4 IHrs: Separator: $ Cement: $ -
Chior: 7000 JSPR#1: 53 @ 600 - |Hoater: $ Bits: $ -
Ica : 120  [SPR#2: 54 @ 550 [woB: 15/20 IPumping LT % Mud Motors: $ 2,500
IDapp ppb: 4.4 IBtm.Up: 51  |RPM: 45 + 56 Prime Mover:  $ Corrosion; $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: IDain Total: $ Drilling Mud: $ 2530
6:00 9:30 3:30 |DRLG. F/12125' T/12200' 75" 21.4 fph Misc. / Labor: $ -
9:30 13:00 3:30 JCIRC.& COND. FOR LOGS Csg. Crew: $ -
13:00 13:30 0:30 JPUMP PILL & DROP SURVEY Daily Total: $ 21,045
13:30 22:30 9:00 [TRIP OUT TO LOG (NO TIGHT HOLE ) [Cum. wir: $ 88,335
22:30 23:00 0:30 JLAY DOWN MUD MOTOR & BIT I0um. Fuel $ 120,701
23:00 6:00 7.00 JRIG UP SCHLUMBERGER AND RAN PLATFORM EXPRESS |0um. Bits: $ 46,000
TO 12165' WELL STARTED TO FLOW - PULLED WIRE OUT BHA
WITH HYDRIL CLOSED TO 50' - HAD 800 PSI SHUT IN PRESS. 7 7/8" Bit 778" 1.00
BLEAD OFF PRESS. THRU CHOKE AND PULLED TOOLS OUT - JMud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
CLOSED BLIND RAMS AND RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER 21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = ' 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: 20% Shale - 80%Sandstone BKG GAS
S$/10 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 0 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS




087

] /05 R gs S0
Y3-049- 3497y

@® GASCOENERGY

DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

 CONFIDENTIAL

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: MIXING MUD - WT. TO 16 ppg  |Date: 12/05/2004  |Days: 70
Depth: 12200 lProg: D Hrs: IAV ROP: Formation: Spring Canyon
DMC: TMC: $171,635 TDC: $22,618 JCWC: $2,304,845
Contractor: Nabors # 924 MudCo: M- TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
jmw: 14 I# 1aem  6.5X11 [Bit#: 14 [Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 60 SPM: Size: 77/8" Surf, Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -
fpviyp: 20017 [#2410m  6.5X10 [Type: HC 506 2 ilnt. Csg: $ - |Day Rate: $ 12,500
IGeI: 8122 ISPM: 103 [MFG: HTC IProd Csg: % - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
IWL: 18 GPM : 422 SIN: 7105015 IFIoat Equp: $ - {Trucking: $ -
Cake: 1 JPress: 2000 Qets: 6X 15 IWeII Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 18 AV DC: 320 |Jin: 11604 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ 4103
Sand: 1 AV DP: 215  Jout: 12200 JPackers: $ - ___|Mud Logger: $ 700
IPH : 9 JetVel: 113 JFTG: 596 Tanks: $ - [Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4/45 |ECD 10.4  JHrs: 47 |Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 7000  ISPR#1: 53 @ 600 JFPH: 12.7 IHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120  |SPR#2: 54 @ 550 [wOB: 15/20 IPumping LT: 3 - |Mud Motors: $ 2,500
|Dapp ppb: 3 IBtm.Up: 51 IRPM: 45 + 56 Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: T/BIG: 0/0/0 IMlsc: $ - |Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 565 IDaily Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: $ -
6:00 .15:00 8:00 JTHAW MUD LINES IN ORDER TO PUMP INTO WELL Misc. / Labor: $ -
15:00 6:00 16:00 JPUMP INTO WELL DEAD HEAD WITH 15 ppg MUD, PRESS. DEC. |Csg. Crew: $ -
FROM 2100 psi TO 1700 psi WITH 200 bbl - BLEAD OFF GAS AND |Daily Total: $ 22,618
MiX MORE MUD - PUMPED 200 bbl 15 ppg DEC. F/1700 psi T/1100 JCum. Wtr: $ 88,335
BLEAD OFF GAS AND MIX MORE MUD, TAKING WT. TO 16 ppg _JCum. Fuel $ 12,803
THIS TIME Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
BHA
STILL THAWING OUT MUD LINES WITH HOT OILER 7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
BOILER NOT WORKING, NO ONE SHOWED UP TO JMud Motor 61/2" 31.59
FIXIT YET 21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
PIU LITH: BKG GAS
S§/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LLAST CSG.RAN: B5/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man 5.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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@ GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

CONFIDENTIAL

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: BLEED OFF PRESS. Date: 12/06/2004 |Days: 71
Depth: 12200' |Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation: Spring Canyon
DMC: TMC: $171,535 TDC: $53,375 JCWC: $2,358,220
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
jmw: 14 I# 1asgm  6.5X11 [Bit#: 14 Conductor: $ - JLoc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 60 SPM: Sizae: 7 7/8" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
IPVIYP: 20117 W 24ugm  65X10 [Type: HC 506 Z Jint. Csg: $ -  |Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: 8/22 SPM: IMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - |Rental Tools: $ 1,900
JwL: 18 GPM : SIN: 7105015 IFIoat Equp: $ - [Trucking: $ -
ICake: 1 IPress: Jets: 86X 15 IWell Head: $ - |water: $ -
Solids: 18 AV DC: lin: 11604 TBG/Rods: 3 - |Fuel: $ -
Sand: 1 AV DP: Out: 12200 [Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -
JpH - 9 JetVel: JFre: 596 Tanks: $ - lLogging: $ 38,060
IPfIMf: 4/4.5 JECD IHrs: 47 Separator: $ - |Cement: $ -
Chlor: 7000 ISPR # IFPH: 12.7 JHeater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR #2: WOB: 15720 IPumping ut: § - |Mud Motors: $ -
[Dapp ppb: 3 |Btm.Up: IRPM: 45 + 56 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 20
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMIsc: $ - |Consuitant: $ 825
START END TIME JRot. Hrs: 565 IDain Total: $ - |Drilling Mud: 3 -
6:00 18:00 12:00 JPUMP 15 ppg MUD INTO WELL - CAN'T GET PRESS TO GO Misc. / Labor: $ -
BELOW 1100 psi fesg. crow: $ :
18:00 6:00 12:00 [NIPPLE DOWN ROT. HEAD & NIPPLE UP WEATHERFORD WIRE |Daily Total: $§ 53,375
LINE LUBRICATOR - SET BRIDGE PLUG @ 3400' BLEAD PRESS. JCum. wtr: $ 88335
OFF TO "0" AND FILLED HOLE WITH 13.5 ppg MUD ICum. Fuel $ 124,803
ICum. Bits: $ 46,000
WE WILL NIPPLE DOWN WEATHERFORD & NIPPLE BHA
UP ROT.HEAD - THEN RUN IN HOLE WITH MILL TOOTH7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
BIT, BHA & D.P. TO 3400', THAW OUT MUD LINES [Mud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
AND RIG BEFORE DRILLING OUT PLUG - SHOULD 21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
HAVE BOILER RUNNING TODAY
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
810 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8” SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man §S.L Seely PEAK GAS
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GASCO ENERGY

DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

CONFIDENTIAL

FED. 22-30-10-18 OPR: THAW OUT RIG & MUD LINES |Date: 12/07/2004 Days: 72
Depth: 12200' |Prog: D Hrs: |AV ROP: Formation: Spring Canyon
DMC: TMC: $171,535 TDC: $29,220 JCWC: $2,387,440
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
Imw: 14 |# Tasem  6.5X11 Bit#: 14 Conductor: $ - |Loc,Cost: $ -
VIS: 60 SPM: ISize: 778" Surf. Csg: $ - |Rig Move: $ -
lpvrye: 2017 H#2umm  6.5X10 [Type: HC 506 Z Jint. Csg: $ -  |Day Rate: $ 12,500
Gel: 8/22 SPM: IMFG: HTC IProd Csg: $ - Rental Tools: 3 1,900
JWL: 18 GPM : S/N: 7105015 IFIoat Equp: $ - |Trucking: $ -
lCake: 1 JPress: Jets: 6X 15 Well Head: $ - |water: $ -
ISoIids: 18 AV DC: lin: 11604 TBG/Rods: $ - |Fuel: $ 4125
ISand: 1 AV DP: IOut: 12200 JPackers: $ - {Mud Logger: $ -
IPH : 9 JotVel: IFTG: 596 Tanks: $ - __|Logging: $ -
IPfIMf: 4145 JECD IHrs: 47 ISeparator: $ - lCement: $ -
Chlor: 7000  |SPR#1: IFPH: 12.7 IHoater: $ - |Bits: $ -
Ca : 120 ISPR#2: IWOB: 15/20 lPunlping L/T: $ - |Mud Motors: $ -
[Dapp ppb: 3 IBtm.Up: IRPM: 45 + 56 Prime Mover: $ - |Corrosion: $ 90
Time Break Down: TIBIG: 0/0/0 IMisc: $ - [Consultant: $ 825
START END TIME 'Rot. Hrs; 565 IDain Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -
6:00 18:00 12:00 |NIPPLE DOWN LUBRICATOR AND NIPPLE UP ROT. HEAD Misc. / Labor: $ 9,780
18:00 6:00 12:00 JTRIP IN HOLE TO PLUG, INSTALL ROT HEAD RUBBER AND Csg. Crew: $ -
CONTINUE TO THAW OUT MUD LINES & MUD PITS - BOILER Daily Total: $ 29,220
WAS RUNNING FROM 4:00 PM TO 1:00 AM AND 1S DOWN AGAIN Jcum. wtr: $ 88,335
NOT ABLE TO CIRC. WELL YET Cum. Fuel $ 128,928
Cum. Bits: $ 46,000
BHA
CAST IRON PLUG SET @ 3400' NO PRESS OR FLOW }7 7/8" Bit 77/8" 1.00
[Mud Motor 6 1/2" 31.59
21-D.C. 6 1/4" 631.77
TOTAL BHA = 664.36
Survey
Survey
P/U LITH: BKG GAS
S§/0 FLARE: CONN GAS
ROT. 0 LAST CSG.RAN: 85/8" SET @ 3455 TRIP GAS
FUEL Used: On Hand: Co.Man S.L.Seely PEAK GAS
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BLM Vemal Field Office
170 south, 500 East
Vernal, UT 84078
State of Utah

Division of Oil Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple 1210
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Transmittal Form

By this letter we hear by transmit to you logs on the following Gasco Production Company
wells:

¢“Federal 22-30-10-18 77 /0S RIQE S-30 HPIF 93-087-39974
¢ Federal 21-6-10-19
¢Federal 43-30-9-19
¢ Federal 11-22-9-19

Please acknowledge receipt of this data by signing below and returning a copy of this
Transmittal to the address listed below. A SASE is provided. Thank you.

Canil Y St /a?/y?//f;e vof

Signature and Acknowledgement Date

Gfate of (LK,

Agency (i.e/BLM or State of Utah)

H:Forms\TransmittalBLM &StateUT

GASGO Energy, Inc.
14 Inverness Drive East, Suite H-236 Tel: {303) 483-0044 Email:  invest@gascoenergy.com
Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: {303) 483-0011 Website: www.gascoenergy.com OTCBB: GASE



GAScoqy®
Energy

July 6, 2005

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801

Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re:  Federal Completion Forms
Federal 44-20-9-19
Federal 24-20-9-19
Federal 11-21-9-19
Federal 11-22-9-19

Federal 22-2510-18
Federal 21-6-10-19
Uintah County, UT

Ladies and Gentlemen::

Enclosed per your request are originally signed Federal Completion Forms for the
captioned wells. Be advised that completion forms for the State 24-16-9-19, Federal 41-
31-9-19 and the Federal 31-21-9-19 wells will be provided under separate cover.

Sincerely,

Gasco Production Company

Mari A. Johnson
Manager of Property Administration
Direct Telephone: 303-996-1815

Cc: Tony Sharp, Gasco Production JUL 11 2005

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

GASCO Energy, Inc.
8 Inverness Drive East, Suite 100 Tel: (303} 483-0044 Email: invest@gascoenergy.com
Englewood, €O 80112-5625 Fax: (303) 483-0011 Wabsite: www.gascoenergy.com AMEX: GSX



Ferm 3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) ° DEP ENT OF THE INTERIOR ' OMB NO. 1004-0137
BUR™ OF LAND MANAGEMENT N Expires: November 30, 2000
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. Leasc Scrial No.
UTU-74408
1a. Type of Well D oil a Gas D Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Completion: m New D Work Over D Deepen D Plug Back D Diff. Resvr. NA
Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and
- NA
2. Name of Operator 8. Lease Name and Well No.
Gasco Production Company Federal 22-30-10-18
3. Address 3a, Phone No. (include area code) 9 API Well No.
14 Inverness Drive East, Ste. H-236, Englewood, CO 80112 303-483-0044 43-047-34924

4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

Atsurface 1968" FNL & 2161’ FWL (SENW) Sec. 30-T10S-R18E, SLM Riverbend
11, Sec., T, R, M., or Block and
At top prod. interval reported below  SAME Survey or Are 30-T108-R18
12. County or Parish [ 13. State
At total depth SAME Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15, Bate T.1). Reached léﬁteﬁ(‘g{m‘zleted E_L Ready to Prod 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*
08/05/04 12/03/04 01/27/05 5456.9' KB/ 5439.5' GL
18, Total Depth: MD 12235 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set MD
TVD 12235 VD VD
21 Typc Electric & Olhc;r Mechamcal Logsﬁm)}(bubn'm copy of ea;}h) o - PR 22. Was well cored? No Des(Submil analysis)
v / . 3 7 N f
Z //71 yay /]‘ 2, */L-‘-l-'"’ VT [ A /(' / M G Was DST run” XA no l:‘(..s (Submit copy)
. L) [, s 41 £) W ,.4’](, g el Directional Survey? 1 wNo Dch(Submil copy)
23. Casing and Liner Record FR_eI;;)"rlall sirings sel in we[l)
Hole Size | Size/Grade | Wi (#/11) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Shury Vol. Cement Top*¥ Amount Pulled
Depth Type of Cement (BBL)
17-1/2" 113-3/8" K-55| 54.4% surface 218 225 CI-G - CIRC surface
12-1/4" | 8-5/8" J-55 32# surface 3457 610 HiLift + 260 Gj- CIRC & 200 G TOP 558 bbl surface
7-718" |4-1/2"P110} 13.5# surface 12203 1165 HiLift+1710 50/50 Poz/G 776 bbl 300°
24. Tubing Record
Sive Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MBY Size Depth Sct (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Pepth Set (MDPacker Set (MD
2 3/8" 11332
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
A} Mesaverde 11978 12038 11978-11984, 12028-18, 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 96 producing
R) Mesaverde 11850 11860 11850-60 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 30 producing
) Mesaverde 11392 11486 11392400, 11482-86 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 36 producing
D)
)
F)
H)
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.
Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
11978-12038 4500# 100 mesh, 139,000# 20-40 tempered LC, 81354# 20-40 Econoprop, using 3924 bbls WF and YF 118 gel.
11850-11860 68,831# 20-20 Econoporp, using 2080 bbls YF and WF 118 gel.
11392-11486 155,318 # 20-40 Econoprop, using 2451 bbls YF 125 and 120 gel.
28. Production - Interval A-C Mesaverde
Date Firat  |Test Date {Hours Test il Gas Water il Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Tested Producti |[BBL MCF BBL Comr. API
01/27/05 01/27/05 | 96 [ > Flowing
Choke Thyg. Press. Csg.
Size Tlwg. X Press.
42/64" |51 225| 675 |>» 60 2147 0
28
Date First | Test Date jHours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Cias, Gravity Production Method
Produced Tested chli BBL MCF BBL Corr. AP1
Choke Thg. Press. H tut l V t U
Size Flwg.
> Ju-H1-2005

(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)

e S TR R Il QS P a ]



28h.

"Liute First | Test Hours Test 0il Gas Water Oil Gravity Giasy ity Production Method
Produced |Date Tested Production  |B! MCF BBL Corr. AP1

Choke Theg. Press.  |Csg. 24 Hr. il Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status

Size Flwg. Press. Rate BRL MCF BBL Ratio

| -—-—\)

28b. Production

Date First | Test Hours Test il Gas Water il Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced [Date Tested Producgion |BBL MCF RBBIL. Corr. AP1

Choke Thyg. Press.  |Csg. 24 Hr. il Gas Water Gas : 0il Well Stalus

Siee Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

s1 —>
29. Disposition of Gas (Sold. used for fuel, vented, etc.)
Sold

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures

and recovencs.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name Mcazol_l:;cpth
Uinta Surface| 4,606
Wasatch 4,606 8,646 |Sand and Shale
Mesaverde 8,646 11,074 |Sand and Shale
Castlegate 14,074 | 11,301 |Sand and Shale
Blackhawk 11,301 Sand and Shale

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other

36. I hereby certify that the forcgoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) ,36""1 Longwell 4.7 Title Operations Manager
. Datc February 17, 2005

Signature

¥

|
X ]V
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and TXfeél USC. S
States any false, fictitious or fraudulgnt stateme;

on 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully o make to any department or agency of the United
or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

RECEIVED & U.S. GPO: 1999-573-62
JUL 112005

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING




“orm 31604
(August 1999)

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG

ITED STATES
DEPAR NT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB NO. 1004-0137
Expires: November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.

UTU-74408
Ta. Type of Well ﬁ oil ﬁ Gas ﬁ Dry Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
b. Type of Complction: D New Work Qver D Deepen D Plug Back D Diff. Resvr. ‘ NA
Other 1"\ :"’\] \ 1 " B ;‘ :\_\‘S :,"g ‘& 7. Unitor CAQ)g;eemem Name anc
= Tt L TV Vo

2. Name of Operator

Gasco Production Company

8. Lease Name and Well No.
Federal 22-30-10-18

3. Address

8§ Inverness Drive East Ste 100, Englewood Colorado 80112

3a. Phone No. (include area code)

303-483-0044

QO APT Wall N~

43-047-34924

4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements) *

At surface

COMEEN AL

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
Riverbend
Sec., T., R, M., or Block and

1968' FNL & 2161' FWI1. (SENW) Sec. 30-T105-R18E, SL.M

At top prod. interval reported below  SAME « Survey or Are 30-T108-R18!
: ) 12; County or Parish | 13. State
At total depth SAME ) < Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16 Date Completed m R w_].’v,.;]ﬁ. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*
08/05/04 12/03/04 paa Kt L Rl e 5456.9' KB/ 5439.5' GI.
18. Total Depth: MD 19. Plug Back TD. MD 20. Depth Bridge Plug Set MD
TVD 12235 TvD TVD
21. Type Electric & Other Mechanical Logs Run (Submit copy of each) 22, Was well cored? m No  [Yes(Submit analysis)
Was DST run? m No D’es (Submit copy)
FDC/CNL/GR/SP: GR/CCL/CBL/VDL Directional Survey? A xvo es (Submit copy)
23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)
Hole Size | Size/Grade | Wr.(#) |  Top(MD) | Bottom (MD) S'“g‘;)‘i;';"“'“ T’;; Z:,f:':n:l , S"(’glys:)d' Cement Top*|  Amount Pulled
17-1/2" §3-3/8" K-53] 54.4# surface 218 225 C1-G - CIRC surface
12-1/4" |8-5/8" J-55} 324 surface 3457 610 HiLift + 260 Gj- CIRC & 200 G T 558 bbl surface
7-7/8" |4-1/2" P11 13.5# surface 12203 1165 HiLift+1710 50/50 Poz/G 776 bbl 300"
24, Tubing Record
Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD' Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MDPacker Set (MD?
2 3/8" 9417
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record
Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
AY Mesaverde 11978 12038 11978-11984, 12028-38, 3-3/8" gun, 45" LHD 96 producing
B) Mesaverde 11850 11860 11850-60 3-3/8" gun, 45" EHD 30 producing
Q) Mesaverde 11392 11486 11392-400, 11482-86 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 36 producing
o Mesaverde 9458 11039 | 9458-61; 9497-500; 9562-65; 9676-80' | 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD) 171 producing
m B-60; 10312-16; 10404-07; 10474-77; 10516-19; 10564-66; 105
) 552—60; 11562-72: 11590-600; 10996-11000; 11014-18; 11036+
1 | |

27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Eic,

Depth Interval

Amount and type of Material

11978-12038

11850-11860

4500# 100 mesh, 139,000# 20-40 tempered 1.C, 81354# 20-40 Econoprop, using 3924 bbls WF and YF 118 gel.
68,83 1# 20-20 Econoprop, using 2080 bbls YF and WF 118 pel.

11392-11486

135,318 # 20-40 Econoprop. using 2451 bbis YF 125 and 120 gel.

10996-11039

S9K# 20-40 Econoprop using 2337 bbls YF & WI' 118 gel with scalefrac ™) rf KYASID)

10404-10575

114600# 20-40 Econoprop using 2720 bbls YF & WF 118 gel with scalefrac

9458-9680 131755# 20-40 Tempered LC Sd using 2875 bbls WF & YF gel with scalefrac DEP /[ m

28. Production - Interval A-C Mesaverde T O by NG
Date First  [Test Date JHours Test Oil Gas Water 0il Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Tested Producti [BBL MCF BBL Corr. AP1
01/27/05| 01/27/05 | 96 | > Flowing
Choke |Tbe. Press. Csg. Well Status
- Fiwg. X -

42/64" Jsi 225] 675 |-» | 60 2147 0
28
Date First  |Test Date |Hours Test Oil Cias Water Qil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Tested Producti [BBL MCF BBL Corr. AP1
03/17/05] 03/18/05 | 24 [—» | 22 405 92 Flowing
Choke Thg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. {Oil CGias Water Gas : Oit Well Status
Lima Flwg. Press. R&t__‘ BBL MCF BBL Ratio

20/64" |si 700] 1150 | 2> | 22 403 92 Producing

(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)



- 28b -~ &

Date First |Test Hours Test Qil . Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas G. Production Method
Produced |Date Tested Production  |BBL MCF BBL Corr. AP
Choke Tbg. Press.  [Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

s1 —

<

28b, Production
Date First [Test Hours Test il Gas Water Oil Gravity Cias Gravity Production Method
Produced |Date Tested ProduS‘ion BBL MCF BBL Corr. AP]
Choke The. Press.  |Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Sold, used for fuel, vented, eic.)
Sold

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name MeaZ°l§epth
Uinta Surface | 4,606
Wasatch 4,606 8,646 |Sand and Shale
Mesaverde 8,646 11,074 |Sand and Shale
Castlegate 11,074 | 11,30]1 |Sand and Shale
Blackhawk 11,301 Sand and Shale

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other:

36. I hereby certify that the foregofgg and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please prin)____. ~__ Beverly Wi Iker Title Engineering Tech
signatwe (N dends S LodHon pac _ September 21, 2005
7= 7> "

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

o U.S. GPO: 1999-573-624



Form 3 160-5 . FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) UN]T?ATES ! OMB No. 1004-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Expires Jnovember 30, 2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-74408
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or reenfer an 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA

7. 1f Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE — Other instructions on reverse side

1. Typeof Well NA

3 oil wen X1 Gas Well ) Other 8. Well Name and No.
2. Name of Operator Federal 22-30-1()—18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No.
3a. Address 3b.  Phone No. (include area code) 43-047- 34924
8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado 8o112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T.. R.. M.. or Survey Description) Riverbend

11. County or Parish, State

1968' FNL & 2161 FWL (SENW) Uintah County, Utah

/9S ;56 30

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
[ Notice of Intent 3 Acidize D Deepen [ Production (Start/Resume) D Water Shut-OfT
1 Aher Casing ) Fracture Treat ) Reclamation [} well inteprity
X} Subsequent Report [ Casing Repair ) New Construction ) Recomplete ] Other
D Change Plans D Plug and Abandon D Temporarily Abandon
[C] Final Abandonmeni Notice 3 Convent o Injection ) Plug Back X} Water Disposal

13. Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontaly. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA.  Required subsequent reports shal! be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. Il the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed. and the operator bas
determined that the site isready for final inspection.

This s to inform you that we will be disposing of water from this well as follows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the Iocaﬁomgggﬁfgasﬁg %gt Brennan Bottom
Water Disposal located between Roosevelt and Vernal Utah.  |jtah Division of ‘

Oil, Gas and Mining
FOR RECORD ONLY

14, 1 hereby certify that the foregoing ts true and correct
Name (Prinled/7_'ypfd) Title . . .
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Date

Signature' o é’_/ //Z(/ //{L January 24, 2006
7 /s

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, ifany_ are attached. Approval of this notice does not warranmt or | Office
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title 1o those nghts in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any
false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as o any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse)

RECEIVED
FEB 1 0 2006
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Form 3160- § UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No 1004. 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March 31,2007
5. Lease Serial No
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-74408
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. I Unitor CA. "“‘ee"l‘\j'/“\"‘a"‘e and/or No

1 Typeof Well

DO;I Well Gas Well DOlher 8. Well Name and No

2 Name of Operator Federal 22-30-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No

3a. Address 3b  Phone No. (mchnle area code) 43-047-34924

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool. or Exploratory Area
4 Location of Well (Footage, Sec.. 12, R M., or Survey Description) Riverbend

11. County or Panish. State
Uintah County, Utah
12, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

1968 FNL & 2161' FWL SE NW of Section 30-T10S-R18E

TYPL OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
I:IN(mce of Intent DAcidizc I:]l)ccpcn Dl’rodncuon( Start/ Resume) DWalcr Shut-off
D/\hcnng Casing Dl’mclurc Treat chclmnmmn DWC" Integrity
Subscqucnl Report I:lt'asm): Repatr DNL’\A Construction DRccomplclc ()tlu:u
D(‘hange Plans Dl’lny and abandon D'I‘cmpomnly Abandon EFM Meter
Dhnal Abandonment Notice D(‘onvcn to Injechion DPIug back DWnlcr Disposal

13 Desenibe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertment detals. includimg estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereo!
If the proposal 1s to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally. give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following compiction of the involved operations. Il the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval. a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all regurements. mcluding reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for tinal inspection

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 3500) to measure production from this well and will be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM reqgulations.

APR 2 6 2006

DY QF oo
14 1 hereby certify that the foregoing 1s true and correct
Name (Primted  Typed)
Title
Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

s ///1[/ | / / . // Pate April 21, 2006

"THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrani o
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title 1o those rights in the subject lease] Office
which  would  entitle_the  applicant 10 conduct _ operations thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 US.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or apency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as 1o any matter within its junisdiction

fInstructions on page 2)



UNITED STATES

Form 31060- 5
(April 2004)

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB No 1004- 0137
Expires March 31, 2007

S Lease Senal No
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-74408
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 IfUnitor CA. Agreement Name and/or No
1 Type of Well NA
Oil Well (ias Well DOIher 8 Wel Name and No
2 Name of Operator Federal 22-30-10-1 8
Gasco Production Company 9 APl Well No
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. finciude area code) 43-047-34924
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool. or Exploratory Arca

4 Location of Well tl-vorage, Sec. 1. R M. or Survey Description) Riverbend
N L _— L ) . N o County or Pansh, State
1963" FNL & 2161' FWIE. SE NW of Section 30-T10S-R18E . .
Uintah County. Utah
12, CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
|:]Nollcc of Inent D/\c:dlze l:]l)eepen Producllon( Start/ Resume) DW:)ICI Shut-olf
DAhcnng Casmg Dl:mclurc Treat I:]Rcclmnalmn DW:H Inteprty
Suhscqucnl Repont l:](‘zlsmg: Repan DNcw Construction Dkecnmp'c!c D( dther
D(‘hangc Plans Dplug and abandon D’l'cmpnmnly Abandon
Dl"mul Abandonment Notice I:](‘(mvcﬂ to lmyyection I:]Plug back [:]Wmcr Disposal
13 Desenbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated staring date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

I the proposal 1s 1o deepen directronally or recomplete honzontatly, give subsurface Jocations and measured and true ventical depths of al? pertinent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followmg completion of the involved operations. It the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion ina new mierval. a Fonn 3160-4 shall be filed once

testg has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only afier
determined that the sue isready for final inspection

all requirements, including reckamation, have been completed. and the operator has

This well was started on production on 1/27/2003

Helatel
APR 2 6 2006

IV
L N N

14 1 hereby cerhify that the foregomp is true and correct
Name (Printed Tvped)

Beverly Walket

Title

Engineering Technician

Date

April 21, 2000

W)?“/m/( ey v/iae

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Tile Date
Condiions of approval. »f any are aitached Approval of this notice does not warrant of]

certify that the apphcant holds legal or equitable title 1o those nghts in the subject lease]Office

which  would  entitle  the  applicamt__to  conduct __ operations  thereon 21-Apr

Title 18 USC Section 1001 AND Title 43 US.C Section 1212. make it a cnme for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

States any false, licitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within

1ts junsdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)

OV b A e e



Form 3160- § UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007
S. Lease Senal No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-74408
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well NA

D Oil Well DOther

8. Well Name and No.

[X]ow v
2. Name of Operator

Gasco Production Company

Federal 22-30-10-18

9. APl Well No.

3a. Address
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
303-483-0044

43-047-34924

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Fomrage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)

1968 FNL & 2161' FWL SE NW of Section 30-T10S-R18E

Riverbend

11. County or Parish, State

Uintah County. Utah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION

TYPE OF ACTION

DAcidiu
DAlleﬁng Casing
DCasing Repair
DChange Plans
DConven to Injection

Nolice of Intent
DSubsequent Report

DF inal Abandonment Notice

D Deepen

l:] Fracture Treat
DNew Construction
DPlug and abandon
I:] Plug back

DProduclion ( Start/ Resume)

D Reclamation
D Recomplete
DTemporarily Abandon

Walcr Disposal

D Water Shut-off
DWeII Integnity
DOlher

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site isready for final inspection.

This is to inform you that effective immediately we will be disposing of produced

water from this well as follows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
State Evaporation Facility NW 1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E Uintah County, Utah. Which is owned by
Gasco Production Company. A copy of the approved permit for this facility is attached.

RECEIVED
OCT 2 4 2006

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. | hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed Typed)
Title i X
Beverly Walkg/ Engineering Tech
Si T - $ Dat
o é;f//{ - ///(é/, - October 18, 2006
/| P THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or]

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable tite to those rights in the subject Jease]Office

which  would entitle the applicant to  conduct

operations

thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudul or repr

ns as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

{Instructions on page 2)



Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-74408
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well NA

DOil Well DOther

8. Well Name and No.

Gas Well
2. Name of Operator

Gasco Production Company

Federal 22-30-10-18
9. API Well No.

3a. Address
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112

3b. Phone No. (include area code)
303-483-0044

43-047-34924
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description)
1698 FNL & 2161' FWL
SENW Sec 30 TIOS RI8E

Riverbend
11. County or Parish, State

Uintah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent DAcidize DDeepen DProduction ( Start/ Resume) DWater Shut-off
D Altering Casing D Fracture Treat DReclamation D Well Integrity

D Subsequent Report D Casing Repair DNew Construction DRecomplete Other  Drill scale/fill
DChange Plans DPlug and abandon DTemporan'ly Abandon

DFina] Abandonment Notice DConvert to Injection E:IPlug back DWater Disposal

. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed  Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site isready for final inspection.

Gasco intends to drill out scale below the the current end of tubing (10573"). A slickline was run
in July indicating the presence of fill or scale covering open perforations. Uncovering these
perforations should help enhance production by increasing flow rate from blocked perforations
and increase pressure maitenance fo help slow down the liquid loading problems this well has
been having. No zones are anticipated to be abandoned and tybing is planned to be hung off at
OV ST ebeRltotme depth * Accepted by the

it { f
' L Jtah Division O
pate: /1 lo* 2008 O'}iB Gas and Mining

1£5 %‘Q“(&ﬁ

Federal Approval Of This
Action Is Necessary

Initials:

Daie: " A
14. T hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct. By: Lo 1 L
Name (Printed/ Typed) d
Title .
Matt Owens Petroleum Engineer
Sig Date
September 10, 2008

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant o
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease] Office
which _would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon B
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent stat ions as to any matter within its jurisdiction. ¥

ts or rep.

Agency of the United

(Instructions on page 2)

DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING



Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

FORM APPROVED
OMB No. 1004- 0137
Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-74408
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
. abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnit or CA. Ag'ee‘;]ez Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well

DOil Well Gas Well DOther

8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator
Gasco Production Company

Federal 22-30-10-18
9. API Well No.

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044

43-047-34924
10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description)
1698 FNL & 2161 FWL
SENW Sec 30 TI0S R18E

Riverbend
11. County or Parish, State

Uintah

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

DNoﬁce of Intent DAcidize DDeepen DProduction ( Start/ Resume) DWater Shut-off

D Altering Casing D Fracture Treat DRec]amation
Subsequent Report DCasing Repair DNew Construction DRecomplete
DChange Plans DPlug and abandon [:ITemporarily Abandon
D Final Abandonment Notice DConvert to Injection DPlug back DWater Disposal

D Well Integrity
[X]omer  potiscatern

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. I the operation tesults in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has

determined that the site isready for final inspection.

Gasco started working over this well on 9/18/2008. Scale was found @ approximately 10,558’
The bit fell through the scale @ ~10,600" and drilled down to PBTD @ 11,955" We suspect the
fish that was originally in the hole at 10,771 was pushed down to the new PBTD of 11,955"
Tubing was re-landed at 9,454' w/ 302 joints of 2 3/8" 4.7# N-80 tubing.

RE CEIVED
Ucr g7 2008
DiV. OF ClL, GAS & MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Printed/ Typed)
Titl
Matt Owens— o Petroleum Engineer
Si o Date
October 1, 2008
' THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL. OR STATE OFFICE USE
Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant of]
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease]Office

which _would__entitle the applicant to  conduct operations __ thereon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Titie 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)



Form 3160- § UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(April 2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004- 0137
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007
5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-74408
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6. 1f Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. NA
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7. 1 Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.
1. Type of Well NA
E]O" Well Gas Well DOther 8. Well Name and No,
2. Name of Operator Federal 22-30-10-18
Gasco Production Company 9. APIWell No.
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 43-047-34924
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M., or Survey Description) Riverbend
£ 968 1698 FNL & 2161' FWL 11. County or Parish, State
SENW Sec 30 TI0S R18E Uintah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

L__—_INotice of Intent DAcidize DDeepen Production ( Start/ Resume) DWater Shut-off
DAltéring Casing Dchture Treat DRec]amation DWell Integrity
Subsequent Report D Casing Repair E:I New Construction DRecomp]ete D Other

DChange Plans DPlug and abandon DTemporarily Abandon

I:l Final Abandonment Notice D Convert to Injection D Plug back D Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.

This well was brought back onto production 9/26/2008.

RECEIVED
UCT 07 7003
DIV. OF OIL, GAS & MINING

14. 1 hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Name (Printed/ Typed)

: Title
Matt Owens //4"’/7 Petroleum Engineer

Si e N Date
@ %g 2 ﬁ October 1, 2008

o THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by ’ Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant of
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject leasefOffice
which _would _entitle the applicant to  conduct operations __thereon
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent stat ts Or rep ions as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

(Instructions on page 2)




Completion
1/1/05

1/5/05

1/6/05

1/7/05

1/8/05
1/10/05
1/14/05

1/15/05

Gasco Production Company
Federal 22-30-10-18
SE NW of Section 30#-T10S-R18E
Uintah County Utah,
043-047-34924

Set 15 frac tks.

MIRU Slumberger Wireline unit (Dwayne). Ran CBL/Gamma Ray/ CCL
log. RU Doublejack testing. Tested csg to 9000 psi, ok. RIH to perforate
Spring Canyon. 1% gun failed to fire (bottom gun, 12,028 - 38°).
Perforated upper bench f/ 11978 — 84°, 6 spf w/ Powerjet chgs, .45 EHD,
38.6” pen. SICP came up to 1250 psi in 1 min and stabilized @ 2400 psi
in 10 min. POOH w/ gun. Repaired gun #1 and ran back in hole. Still
wouldn’t fire. Opened well up to flowback @ 11:00 PM, on 12/64” ck, w/
2450 SICP. Fell off to 400 FCP @ 11:05 min,

2450 SICP @ 11:00 PM
400 FCP @ 11:05 on 12/64” ck

500 @ 11:10

600 @ 11:15

875 @ 11:20 SI to RU SLB. Opened back up on 20/64”. Fell off
to 50 psi and flowing.

r;

Well flowing back this AM w/ 1650 psi on 20/64” ck, flowing +- 15 bph
to pit. TR 200 bbl BLWTR -20 (180 bbls csg cap). SWI w/ 1100 psi.
RU SLB and perforate bottom 10° of Spring Canyon f/ 12028 — 38’, 6
spf w/ powerjet guns. Opened well up to pit again @ 7:00 PM, after 3 hrs
SI, w/ 2950 SICP. J&R finishing pipeline. Should be ready to sell gas

tomorrow. - £

7:00 AM, Well flowing to pit w/ 950 FCP, on 24/64” ck @ +- 6 bph. TR
375. Slugging water mist and dry gas. Put well thru sep @ 5:00 PM.
(SCE)

RU Delcso slickline and RIH w/ BHP tools. Hung off above perfs and
SWI for buildup. (SCE)

Pulled pressure bomb, and RIH w/ another. Left well SI for continued
build up. (SCE)

Set 2 more frac tks and started filling.

MIRU Schlumberger (Red crew-Selwin). Fraced Spring Canyon fracture
zone Stage 1. Opened well head w/ 820 psi CP. Loaded csg w/ 90 bbls.
Page 1
Federal 22-30-10-18



1/16/05

1/17/05

1/18/04

1/19/05

1/20/05

Gasco Production Company
Federal 22-30-10-18
SE NW of Section 301-T10S-R18E
Uintah County Utah,
043-047-34924

Pumped into fractures @ 2620 psi @ 20.5 bpm. Preformed rev step rate
test. ISIP O psi. Calculated ? 15 holes open ?. Hybrid- Frac well w/
4500# 100 mesh, 139,000# 20-40 tempered LC, 81354# 20-40
Econoprop, using 3924 bbls WF and YF 118 gel. Flushed w/ 176 bbls
(2.5 bbls short). Job went well w/ positive Nolte throughout job, after
fracture filled (1000 bbls). Opened well up to flowback @ 12:10 PM, on
12/64” ck, w/ 4050 SICP. Made 391 bbls in 3 ¥ hrs. SI @ 3:45 PM w/
1300 FCP to perf Aberdeen Stage 2. RU SLB Wireline (Dwayne) and set
Baker FTFP 11880°. Perforated Aberdeen f/ 11850 — 60°, 3 spf w/ 3
3/8” Powerjet gun, 60 deg phased, .45 EHD, 38.6” pen, 22.7 gm chgs. RU
SLB to frac Stage 2. Broke down Aberdeen with 5955psi at 4.5 BPM.
Perform reverse step rate test, ISIP-4620psi, 13 holes open. Hybrid Frac
well with 68831# 20-40 Econoprop, using 2080 bbls YF and WF 118
gel. Flushed well w/ 174 bbls (2.8 bbls short). ISIP 4520. Opened well
up to flowback @ 7:20 PM on 12/64” ck, w/ 4300 SICP. 1 . -
" __{(JDL and SCE)

7:00 AM, well flowing back @ 800 FCP on 16/64” ck. Made 1128 bbls in
11 hrs. TR 1519. BLWTR 4485. RU SLB Wireline (Orlin) to plug and
perf Desert and Grassy Stage #3. Set Baker 10K FTFP @ 11504°. Gun
#1 wouldn’t fire. Shot gun #2 f/ 11392° — 400. POOH and found ground
had pulled loose. RIH again and shot 11482 — 86’. Lost 2.5 hrs due to
failed run. RU SLB Red crew (Selwin) to frac Stage 3, Desert and Grassy.
Broke dn perfs @ 5073 psi @ 5.3 bpm. Calculated 21 holes open /36.
Fraced well w/ 155318# 20-40 Econoprop, using 2451 bbls YF 125 and
120 gel. Flushed w/ 167 bbls (2.9 bbls short). ISIP 5434. F.G. 91.
Opened well up to flowback @ 2:15 PM on 12/64” ck w/ 4900 SICP.

¢

7:00 AM, well flowing back @ 900 FCP on 20/64” ck. Made 1459 in 16
% hrs. TR 3026. BLWTR 5262. (SCE)

7:00 AM, well flowing back @ 350 FCP on 24/64” ck. Made 637 in 24
hrs. TR 3663. BLWTR 4625. Changed back to 16/64” ck to build
pressure. (SCE)

7:00 AM, well flowing w/ 200 FCP on 16/64” ck. Flowed 154 bbls in 24
hrs. TR 3817. BLWTR 4471. (SCE)

7:00 AM. Well flowing back @ 225 FCP on 16/64” ck. Flowed 137 bbls
in 24 hrs. TR 3954. BLWTR 4334. MIRU Temples rig. Brand-X
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1/21/05

1/22/05

1/23/05

1/24/05

1/25/05

1/26/05

1/27/05

3/4/05

Gasco Production Company
Federal 22-30-10-18
SE NW of Section 301-T10S-R18E
Uintah County Utah,
043-047-34924

Wireline RTH w/ Baker 5K kill plug and set @ 11218°. Bled csg off. ND
frac tree. NU BOPE. SDFN. (SCE)I"™ ~

SWI @ 11:00 AM w/ 100 FCP. TR 3991. BLWTR 4297. PU and RIH
w/ Reed 3 %” cone bit + pump off bit sub w/ float + 1 jt + XN nipple +
new, 2 3/8” N-80 tbg (f/ J&R yard). PU Weatherford power swivel.
SDFN. (Kelly w/ Premier) R

Fin RIH and drilled up Baker kill plug @ 11218’. Well did not kick off
flowing. Pump dn tbg w/ hot oiler and got very weak returns. Pumped
total of 210 bbls and still didn’t get good returns. SDFN. (Kelly w/
Premier)

MIRU Weatherford air-foam unit. Fired unit up and compressor seized
up. RD. MIRU Ace West air-foam unit. Unloaded hole and drill up
FTFP @ 11504’ in 45 min. RIH and tagged @ 11880. Drilled up second
plug in 3 % hrs. POOH w/ 18 jts and SDFN. Left well open to pit for
night. (Kelly w/ Premier) T

Well dead this AM. TR 4140. BLWTR 4148. RIH and started drilling
again. Drilled up rest of plug. RIH and tagged sd @ 11997°. Circ cln to
PBTD @ 12151°. LD 26 jts and landed tbg @ 11332’ w/ 363 jts. ND
BOPE. NU tree. Pump off bit and bit sub. Left well flowing to pit for
night. (Kelly w/ Premier)

Flowed 20 bbls before csg died @ 10:00 PM. TR 4160. BLWTR 4128.
Opened tbg up w/ 2200 SITP. Blew dead. RIH w/ swab. Hit FL @
3200°. POOH and well kicked off flowing. Flowed 40 — 50 bph all day.
Turned well over to flowback crew for night. (SCE)

Well flowing this AM w/ 175/ 750. Made 935 bbls in 23 hrs. TR 5093.
BLWTR 3193. (SCE)

Well flowing this AM w/ 150/1450. Made 661 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 5756.
BLWTR 2532. Put well thru sep and sold gas. (SCE)

Late costs

Completion, Mohe 2
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3/5/05

3/8/05

3/9/05

3/10/05

3/11/05

Gasco Production Company
Federal 22-30-10-18
SE NW of Section 301-T10S-R18E
Uintah County Utah,
043-047-34924

MIRU Temples WS. FTP: 250psi. FCP: 250psi. Pump 20bbl 2% KCl
H20 down tubing. ND Tree, NU BOP & Washington head. Strip out
tubing hanger. Start laying down production tubing. Had approx #10,000
drag on first 1550°, then started pulling free. Laid down 87Jts — 2700°.
Left annulus to sales all day during job and left selling over night. SI Tbg
& SDFN. (CME)

Check Pressures. SITP: 400psi, FCP:50psi. Load Tubing & Continue
Laying Down Tubing. Total: 367 Jts + XN Nipple & Pumpoff Sub. ND
BOP. NU Frac Tree. RU Schlumberger. RIH w/ 3 %” Gauge Ring To
11070’. RD Schlumb. Will RD Temples in AM. SWI SDFN (CME)

RDMO Temples WS. MIRU SLB Wireline (Jason). RIH and set CIBP @
11820°. Perforated “perf only” shots f/ 11,552 — 60°, 11562 — 72°,
11590 - 600°, 6 spf w/ Powerjet guns. After firing last gun. Gun was
stuck. Worked up and dn. Blew csg dn f/ 1000 psi to 200 psi in an
attempt to get guns free. No fluid to surface. Finally parted weak point
and left gun fish @ 115357 - 11584’ (fish = bottom half of weak point +
CCL + 30 of 3 3/8” gun + plug setting tool). POOH and re-head. RIH w/
Baker FTFP and guns to perf MvL stage 4. Set FIFP #1 @ 11055’.
Perf stg 4 £/ 10996 — 11000°, 11014’ - 18°, 11036 —39’, 3 spf w/ 3 3/8”
Powerjet. SWIFN. (SCE)

RU SLB (Red crew, Selwyn). Loaded csg w/ 110 bbls. Broke dn perfs @
5458 psi @ 9.1 bpm. Increased rate to 40 bpm and pressure broke back
severely, from 8500 psi. Performed rev step rate test. Pressure declining
on each step. ISIP 1900 psi and fell to 0 in 2 %2 min. Suspected that FTFP
had failed. RIH w/ another FTFP and fd that plug #1 was gone. Set plug
#2 @ 11060°. Loaded hole w/ 87 bbls. Eased into formation @ 3.1 bpm
@ 4470 psi. SD w/ ISIP 4175. Determined that 9000 psi FTFP not
enough to frac w/ depleted zone below. Sent frac crew home. RIH w/
Baker 10,000 K Comp BP (#3) and set @ 11055°. Ready to frac. SDFN.
(SCE)

RU SLB frac crew to frac Stage 4. Broke dn perfs @ 5000 psi @ 5 bpm.
ISIP 4300. .82 FG. Calculated 20 holes open /33 Hybrid fraced Stg 4
w/ 59000# 20-40 Econoprop, using 2337 bbls YF and WF 118 and
Scalefrac in prepad. Flushed csg w/ 162 bbls. ISIP 4800. .87 FG. Job
went well. Opened well up to flowback @ 8:45 AM, on 12/64” ck, w/
4100 SICP.

Cleaned up and RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage 5, Mvl.. Set
9K Baker FTFP (#4) @ 10590°. Perforated Stg S £/ 10404 — 07°, 10474

Page 4
Federal 22-30-10-18



3/12/05

3/13/05

3/14/05

3/15/05

Gasco Production Company
Federal 22-30-10-18
SE NW of Section 301-T10S-R18E
Uintah County Utah,
043-047-34924

- 77, 10516 - 19°, 10564 - 66°, 10573 —75°, 3 spf w/ 3 3/8” Power jet
guns. Broke dn perfs @ 4400 psi @ 3.8 bpm. ISIP 4360. .85 FG. Calc
23 holes open / 39. Hybrid fraced Stg 5 w/ 114,600% 20-40 Econoprop,
using 2720 bbls WF and YF 118 gel and Scalefrac prepad. Flushed csg
w/ 153 bbls. ISIP 4380. .85 FG. Job went well. Opened well up to
flowback @ 4:35 PM, on 12/64” ck, w/ 4200 SICP. Flowed all night to
cln up. (SCE)

Well flowing back this AM w/ 1400 FCP on 16/64” ck. Flowed 2122 bbls
in 19 hrs. TR 2122. BLWTR 2935. RIH w/ plug and guns to perf Stage
6. MvL. Set Baker 9K FTFP (#5) @ 10330°. Perf Stg 6 f/ 10252 — 58,
10312 - 16’, 3 spf w/ Powerjet guns as above. Attempt to frac. Very tight
— 8500 psi @ 24 bpm and getting worse. Screened out to 0 bpm as % ppg
sd hit perfs. Flowed back to pit to cln up sd. Tried to pump in again w/ no
success. Blew frac plug. Opened well up to FB for night on 12/64” ck @
2:00 PM. (SCE)

SWI at 4:00 AM w/ 1100 FCP on 16/64” ck. Fid 553 bbls in 17 hrs. TR
2675. BLWTR 3030. RIH w/ Baker 12.5K comp BP. Fd FTFP (#5) still
in place. Set 12.5K CompBP (#6) @ 10329°. Reperforated 10252 - 60°,
6 spf w/ 3 3/8” Powerjet gun. RU SLB and attempt to frac. Pressure
walked up to 8500 psi @ 0 bpm. Bled off to 6500 psi in 20 min. Decision
made to abort Stage 6 frac. RIH w/ guns (no plug necessary) to perf Stage
7, Upper Mv. Perforated f/ 9458 — 61°, 9497 — 9500°, 9562 — 65°,
9676 — 80°, 3 spf w/ Powerjet guns as above. Pumped into perfs @ 4750
psi @ 10 bpm (no real break). Pumping @ 6200 psi @ 30.2 bpm and had
to SD. ISIP 4207. Pod blender mixing tub (slinger) wash hole thru side.
Had to change out blenders. SD WO new blender. RU blender. FD 3260
SICP. Pumped pre-pad w/ Scale frac. ISIP 4000. Bled 140 psi in 4 min.
Calc 28 holes open / 39. Hybrid fraced Stg 7 w/ 131,755# 20-40
Tempered LC sd, using 2875 bbls WF and YF 118 gel and Scalefrac
prepad. Flushed w/ 130 bbls. ISIP 4336. .89 FG. Opened well up to
flowback @ 4:30 PM, on 12/64” ck, w/ 4200 SICP. (SCE) :

Well flowing this AM w/ 1300 FCP on 16/64” ck. Flowed 896 bbls in 14
%2 hrs. TR 3571. BLWTR 5009. Will RU Temples rig tomorrow AM.
(SCE)

Well flowing this AM on 16/64” ck, w/ 400 FCP. Made 211 bbls in 24
hrs. TR 3591. BLWTR 4798. MIRU Temples WS rig. RU SLB and set
Baker Comp kill plug @ 9400°. ND frac tree. NU BOPE. RIH w/ 3 34”
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Gasco Production Company
Federal 22-30-10-18
SE NW of Section 301-T10S-R18E
Uintah County Utah,
043-047-34924

cone bit + Baker pump off bit sub + 1 jt + XN nipple + 2 3/8” tbg. Tagged
plug @ 9400°. Pulled up 20’ and SDFN. (SCE)

3/16/05 RU power swivel. RU Weatherford air foam unit. Break circ w/ air foam
and drill up kill plug (#7). Tag sd @ 10239’. Cln out to plug #6 @
10329’ and drill out. Drill out #5. No increase or decrease in flow ar
pressure. RIH and drill #4 @ 10590°. Circ cln and SDFN. Left well
flowing back to tk for night. (SCE) -

3/17/05 Well flowing this AM @ 750 FCP on 16/64” ck. Made 80 bbls in 21 hrs.
TR 3862. BLWTR 4718. Break circ w/ air foam. RIH and drill up last 3
plugs. Tagged top of perf gun fish @ 11535°. Set 6-10K on plug and
pushed dn hole. Continued pushing fish into rat hole. Had to continue
putting 10k to push Left top of fish @ 11770’ POOH and LD 75 jts and
land tbg @ 9417 w/ 301 jts. Broached tbg to SN. ND BOPE. NU prod
tree. Pumped bit off w/ 12 BW and 1200 psi air foam. SDFN. Turned
well over to flowback crew for night. (Rick w/ Premier).

3/18/05 Well flowing up tbg, to FB tk w/ 250 FTP/900 on 20/64” ck. TR 3887.
BLWTR 4698. RDMOL Temples. SWI and hooked wellhead up to sep. -
Turned well over to Pumpers. (SCE)

9/18/05 Update late costs
9/18/05 Update late costs:
6-26-08 MIRU PLS Slick line, Fish plunger from 9,217°, Fish BHBS from 9,217°.

RIH w/ 1.50” blind box & tagged fill @ 10,573’. RIH w/ 1.906 Tbg
broach, Broach stopped @ 9,375, could not get any deeper. Possible S/N?
(JvG)

9-18-08 500 ftp 700 cp. M.LS.U. & R.U. Pump 30 bbls. N.D. W.H. N.U.
BOP’S. P.O.O.H. w/ 48 jts. tbg. Leave csg. to sales & S.D.F.N. (RICK)

9-19-08 500 tp 400 fcp. Pump 20 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 48 jts. tbg. R.U.
Broach & broach tbg. to 5939 (x-nipple) (ok) P.O.O.H. w/ 205 jts. tbg.,x-
nipple. Pump 30 bbls. down csg. R.ILH. w/ 3 % hurricane bit,bit sub, 202
jts. tbg. (tallying) (Lightning in area) (SCALE STARTED @ APPROX.
2300° SCALE LIGHT GREEN IN COLOR) S.D.F.N. (RICK)
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9-20-08

9-23-08

9-24-08

9-25-08

9-26-08

9-27-08

Gasco Production Company
Federal 22-30-10-18
SE NW of Section 301-T10S-R18E
Uintah County Utah,
043-047-34924

100 sitp 150 fcp. Pump 20 bbls. down tbg. Continue R.ILH. w/ 134 jts.
tbg. Tagged scale @ 10,558 w/ 336 jts. tbg. R.U. Swivel. Drilled down
to 10,580 w/ 337 jts. tbg. (PUMPED 25 BBL. PILL W/ MAGNA FIBER
BEFORE DRILLING) DID NOT GET ANY CIRCULATION. HAD
GOOD GAS BLOW BUT NO CIRC. (Lost 350 bbls.) P.O.0.H. w/ 37
jts. tbg. (2ot above verfs) Leave csg. to sales & S.D.F.N. (RICK)

900 sitp 500 cp. Pump 20 bbls. down tbg. R.LH. w/ 36 jts. tbg. Tagged
@ 10,580°. Mix 30 bbl. pill w/ 20 sks. Magna-fiber. Pump 30 bbls.
Magna-fiber fell out of water in tank. Re-mix w/ 20 bbls. Pump total of
141 bbls. down tbg. & break circ. Drill down to 10,600° & fell thru.
R.LH. w/ 41 jts. tbg. Tagged @ 11,955 w/ 378 jts. tbg. Set 10k onto
fish top. Did not move. P.O.O.H. w/ 76 jts. tbg. (laying down) &
P.O.0.H. w/ 120 jts. tbg. (standing back) Leave csg. to sales & S.D.F.N.
(RICK)

400 sitp 100 fcp. Pump 20 bbls. down tbg. P.O.O.H. w/ 100 jts. Pump 10
bbls. down tbg. & 30 bbls. down csg. P.0.0.H. w/ 142 jts. tbg.,bit sub, 3
% hurricane bit. Pump 20 bbls. down csg. R.L.LH. w/ x-nipple, 302 jts.
tbg. LAND TBG. @ 9454’ W/ 302 JTS. EUE N-80 8 RND TBG. N.D.
BOP’S. N.U. W.H. R.U. Swab. Broach tbg. (ok) L.F.L. @ 1500°. Made
5 runs. Recovered 0 bbls. (MAGNA-FIBER PLUGGING CUPS) S.W.L
& S.D.FN. (RICK)'

0 tp 50 cp. Pump 40 bbls. down tbg. to clean out magna —fiber.
R.U.Swab w/ fishing tool. Latch onto bumper spring & P.O.O.H. LF.L.
@ 6426°. Made 13 runs. Recovered 23 bbls. Magna-fiber still gumming
up cups and cutting them. Leave well shut in & S.D.F.N. (RICK)

100 tp 200 cp. R.U.Swab. Make broach run to x-nipple. Worked up and
down several times thru fluid level. LF.L. @ 4600°. Made 17 runs.
Recovered 78 bbls. Csg. psi came up to 500#’s. at end of day. Leave tbg.
to sales & S.D.F.N. (RICK) ° '

150 tp 800 cp. R.U.Swab. LF.L. @ 4400°. Made 3 runs. Recovered 10
bbls. (SWAB RIG MOVING ONTO LOC.) Leave tbg. to sales &
R.D.S.U. & M.O.LOC. (RICK) (ENDING LOAD TO RECOVER =
465 BBLS. '
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Gasco Production Company
Federal 22-30-10-18
SE NW of Section 301-T10S-R18E
Uintah County Utah,
043-047-34924

9-26-08 MIRU with Triple J Services swab unit. Made 11 runs, recovered 88 bls.
Initial fluid level was 4,000°, ending fluid level was 2,900°. Return well
to production. (JVG)

9/30/08 Installation of BJ Services CAP string. RIH with injection mandrill,
and 2205 duplex stainless steel tubing landed tubing @ 11,400 displaced
methanol in string w/ BJ Services chemical, began injection.(SD)

10/3/08 Misc costs: Field Transfer A-2034, rental for float, N-80, tubing broach,
water for rig. disposal water, location restroom (PME)
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API Well No: 43047349240000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING

FORM 9

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-74408

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
WILKIN RIDGE DEEP

1. TYPE OF WELL
Gas Well

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
FED 22-30-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
GASCO PRODUCTION COMPANY

9. API NUMBER:
43047349240000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER:
8 Inverness Dr. East, Suite 100 , Englewood, CO, 80112 303 483-0044 Ext

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
UTELAND BUTTE

4. LOCATION OF WELL
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:

1968 FNL 2161 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:

Qtr/Qtr: SENW Section: 30 Township: 10.0S Range: 18.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
UINTAH

STATE:
UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
D ACIDIZE D ALTER CASING D CASING REPAIR
!/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: [} cHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS [] cHANGE TuBING [} cHANGE WELL NAME
1/7/2011
D CHANGE WELL STATUS D COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS D CONVERT WELL TYPE
[] SUBSEQUENT REPORT [ peepen [J FRACTURE TREAT [] NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:
D OPERATOR CHANGE D PLUG AND ABANDON D PLUG BACK
D PRODUCTION START OR RESUME D RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE D RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
D SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: D REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION D SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL D TEMPORARY ABANDON
D TUBING REPAIR D VENT OR FLARE !/ WATER DISPOSAL
[] DRILLING REPORT [0 waTER sHuTOFF [0 s1TA sTATUS EXTENSION [0 app ExTENsION
Report Date:
D WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION D OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Gasco would like to dispose of water at Integrated Water management, LLC
state approved commercial disposal facility located in Section 30, 2 south Accepted by the
Range 4 west in North Blue Bench UT. This facility would be used in additionyJtah Division of
to the currently approved disposal facilities that Gasco uses to dispose @jl, Gas and Mining

water from this well. FOR RECORD ONLY

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE

Roger Knight 303 996-1803 EHS Supervisor
SIGNATURE DATE

N/A 12/30/2010

RECEIVED December 30, 2010




NATIONAL 5YSTEM OF PUOLIC LANDS
U5, DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
KUREAU OF LAND MANKGENENT

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
440 West 200 South, Suite 500
Salt Lake City, UT 84101

&
http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html &; \§9
7 oS

IN REPLY REFER TO: FEB 0 5 2013 *&
3180 (UTUS1153X) \
UT-922000

Ms. Frankie L. Martinez

Gasco Energy, Inc.

7979 East Tufts Avenue, Suite 1150
Denver, Colorado 80237

Re:  Automatic Contraction
Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Unit
Uintah and Duchesne Counties, Utah
Dear Ms. Martinez:

Your letter of January 24, 2013, describes the lands automatically eliminated effective September 17,
2012, from the Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Unit Area, Uintah and Duchesne Counties, Utah, pursuant to
Section 2(e) of the unit agreement and requests our concurrence. The lands you have described
contain 44,447.23 acres, more or less, and constitute all legal subdivisions, no parts of which are

included in the Wilkin Ridge (Deep) Participating Areas "A” and “ B". As a result of the automatic
contraction, the unit is reduced to 480.00 acres. :

The following Federal Leases are entirely eliminated from the unit area:

UTUS56947 UTU75084 UTU77063 UTUS88144
UTU68387 UTU75085 UTU78214 UTU88204
UTU68620* UTU75086 UTU78215

UTU74400 UTU75087 UTU78216

UTU74401 UTU75088 UTU80950

UTU74402 UTU75235 UTU81003*

UTuU74403 UTuU75236 UTU81706*

UTU74407 UTU75514 UTU82704

UTU74408 UTU75515 UTU82705

UTU74836 UTuU75672 UTU84262 Tract No. 43 UNLEASED*
UTU74968 UTU76031 UTU84263

UTU74971 UTU76032 UTU84264

UTU75079 UTU76256 UTU84265

UTU75080 UTU76258 UTU88068

UTU75081 UTU76716 UTU88069

UTU75082 UTU76717 UTU88072

*Indicates non-committed lease



The following Federal Leases are partially eliminated from the unit area:

UTU65632 UTU75083

You have complied with the requirements of Section 2(e), provided you promptly notify all
interested parties. If you have any questions, please contact Judy Nordstrom at (801) 539-4108.

Sincerely,
Myw Z Bankr

Roger L. Bankert
Chief, Branch of Minerals

Enclosure
cc: UDOGM
- SITLA

ONRR w/Exhibit “B” (Attn: Nancy McCarthy)
(UTGO1) BLM FOM - Vernal w/enclosure



Division of Qil, Gas and Mining

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:

Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265

7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500

Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237

303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV
WELL INFORMATION:

Well Name Sec [TWN [RNG [API Entity Mineral |Surface |[Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:

1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:

1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A

3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015

4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016

5. UICS on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A

6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None

7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A
NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:

1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUR0027842

2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A

3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUR0027845

DATA ENTRY:

1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on:

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on:

3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on:

4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on:

5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on:
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on:

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:

SUR0035619 -FCB

1/22/2016
1/22/2016
1/22/2016
N/A
1/22/2016
N/A

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016

COMMENTS:

1/22/2016



From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

Well Name Section |TWN |RNG |API Number |Entity |Mineral |Surface |Type |Status
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S | 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S |190E |4304752522 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304752538 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S |190E |4304752544 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304752545 Federal |Federal OW |APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304752546 Federal |Federal OW |APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753026 Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 421-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753027 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753029 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 431-29-9-19 29 090S |190E [4304753030 | Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753031 | Federal Federal GW |APD
Federal 414-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753070 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753073 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753076 Federal |Federal | GW |APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304753078 Federal |Federal (GW |APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S | 190E 4304753079 Federal |Federal GW |APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753080 Federal |Federal GW |APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304753133 Federal |Federal GW |APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754479 State State |GW_|APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754480 State State |GW |APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S |190E |4304754481 State State |GW_|APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754482 State State |GW |APD
State 323-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754483 State State |GW |APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S |190E 4304754529 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304754541 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754542 State State |GW |APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304754543 State State |GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304753012 |19650 Federal |Federal | GW |DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301333098 (15941 |Federal |Federal (GW |OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S |190E 4304736915 {16556 |Fee Fee GW _|OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738573 17201 |Federal Federal |(GW |OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304739777 |18344 |[Federal Federal GW |OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S |190E 4304739800 [17202 |Federal Federal GW |OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S |150E 4301332391 13787 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S |170E 4301332447 114033 |State State |GW_|P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S |150E 4301332475 |14417 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S |170E 4301332560 [14726 |Federal |Federal | GW |P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S |160E 4301332611 14439 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 |State State |GW [P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 124-11-17 4 110S |170E|4301332674 |15537 |Federal |Federal GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S |170E|4301332676 |15242 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332679 14033 |[Federal |Federal  GW |P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S |150E 4301332685 [16082 State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S |170E 4301332730 |15243 |State State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S |170E 4301332773 |15370 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 110S [170E 4301332778 14802 Federal |Federal | GW [P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 1110S |160E 4301332888 15098 |State State |GW P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S [170E|4301333081 |15714 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S |170E 4301333087 ;15807 [Federal |Federal \GW |P
|WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S [170E|4301333099 ;15920 Federal |[Federal GW [P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S |140E 4301333437 |16919 Federal |Federal | GW |P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 i 24 110S !140E 4301333443 /16367 Federal [Federal GW |P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S |180E 4304730129 16266 |State State |OW [P
RBU 5-11D 11 100S |180E 4304730409 9005 |Federal Federal OW P |
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S | 180E 4304730624 (9030 |Federal |Federal |OW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 6-2D 2 100S [180E 4304731190 |7075 |State |State |OW |P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S |190E 4304731200 |6155 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S |180E 4304731280 |16267 |State  |State |OW |P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731352 |16268 [Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731357 |7053 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 8-10D 10 100S |180E 4304731364 (4955 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S |180E 4304731539 |9965 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S [180E 4304731651 |10688 |Federal |Federal OW |P
RBU 2-10D 10 100S |180E[4304731801 {10784 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S |180E [4304733600 |13213 [Federal |Federal  OW |P
RBU 3-12D 12 100S |180E [4304733739 |14492 |Federal |Federal |OW |P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733741 14244 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S |190E|4304733750 |13174 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S |180E 4304733983 |13182 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S |[190E|4304734111 113441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304734168 |14150 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S | 190E 4304734169 |14140 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304734199 |13601 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304734201 |13641 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S |190E 4304734202 |13455 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S |170E [4304734286 |13492 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S |190E[4304734314 |14440 State  |State |GW |P
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 100S | 180E 4304734539 13491 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S |170E |4304734551 |13726 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S |190E 4304734607 113640 Federal |Federal |GW [P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 14304734608 [14151 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S |180E 4304734924 [14280 [Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304735343 14202 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735404 [14203 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S |190E[4304735405 {14928 |Federal |Federal GW |P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S |190E[4304735588 |14418 |State | Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S |190E 4304735606 |14441 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S |190E|4304735614 |14442 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S |190E (4304735623 114640 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304735624 14419 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S |190E|4304735732 14496 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S |190E|4304735733 14519 |Fee Fee |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S |180E 4304735808 |15592 |[Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 100S |190E 4304735844 14356 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304735845 |14639 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S |190E|4304735995 |14871 State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S |190E 4304736093 |14976 |Federal |Federal |(GW |P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S |190E[4304736094 [16120 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736095 |14872 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304736113 |15096 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736219 |14738 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736220 (14763 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S |180E|4304736233 |14764 State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304736241 |14992 [State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S |180E (4304736242 |14716 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S |190E|4304736271 15884 Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736336 |15086 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736368 |15605 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S |190E 4304736442 |15715 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736600 14977 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304736719 |15186 Federal Federal | GW |P




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company

Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 125 090S |180E 4304736727 !15475 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304736739 |15476 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304736740 |15213 |Federal |Federal [GW |P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S |190E|4304736771 |15355 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S | 180E 4304736772 |15338 [Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S ' 190E (4304736817 15212 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S |190F 4304736913 |15187 |Fee Fee |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S |190E 4304736916 (17012 |Fee Fee |GW |P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304737115 |15011 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S |190E (4304737116 |16163 Federal |Federal (GW |P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190F 4304737117 |16275 |Federal [Federal |GW [P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180F 4304737132 |15087 |State  |State |GW [P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737338 15365 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304737611 [16311 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304737612 16051 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737613 (16052 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S (190E 4304737621 |16253 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S |190F [4304737622 |16264 Federal Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S |190E 4304737630 |16557 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737631 15961 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S |180F 4304737646 16023 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S '180F |4304737647 16121 |Federal [Federal GW |P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304737676 16254 State  |State |GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S |180F 4304737677 |15806 |State  |State |GW |P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S |180E 4304738028 |16868 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738336 (16467 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304738337 16119 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S |180E 4304738351 |16884 |Federal [Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738352 |16349 |Federal |Federal (GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S |180F 4304738353 16210 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S | 190F |4304738407 16236 |Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S |180F 4304738465 16558 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304738469 |16449 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S |190E |4304738575 |16312 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S | 190F |4304738673 115832 |Fee Fee |GW [P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S |180E 4304738896 16792 Federal |Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S |190E 4304739170 |16309 |State  |State |GW |P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S '190E 4304739171 /16308 [State  |State |GW |P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S '190F [4304739172 [16310 |State  |State |GW |P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S |190F [4304739717 |17054 Federal |[Federal |GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739729 |17241 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S |180E 4304739730 (17266 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S |180E |4304739773 (17013 |Federal |Federal GW |P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S |190E 4304740233 |17014 |[Federal Federal |GW [P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S |190E 14304751280 |18211 |Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S |190E 4304751281 |18210 |[Federal |Federal | OW |P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190 4304752870 {19647 |[Federal |Federal GW |P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S |190F 4304752872 |19648 |[Federal |Federal |GW |P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 ] 30 090S |190E 4304753011 |19649 |Federal |Federal |GW |P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S |180F (4304753324 [19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753325 |19783 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S |180F |4304753326 19747 |State  |State |GW |P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S |180E 4304753327 |19747 |State  |State |GW |P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S |180F 4304753328 '19783 [State  |State |GW |P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S '170E[4301332677 |15144 |State  |State |GW S
RBU 4-11D 11 100S |180E 14304730718 |16269 |Federal |Federal (OW [S




From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-11D 11 100S |180E |4304730826 116270 |[Federal |Federal OW |S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S |180E 4304731192 16271 |Federal |Federal OW |S
STATE 2-32B 32 090S |190E 4304732221 |11371 State  |State |GW_|S
STATE 9-36A 36 090S |180E |4304732225 |11364 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S |190E 4304733581 |13249 |Federal |Federal |GW |S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S |180E|4304733598 17838 |State  |State |GW |S
FEDERAL 16-26A - 26 090S |180E 4304733601 |12928 |Federal 'Federal | GW |S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S |190E 4304733653 13077 |[Federal Federal (GW |S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S |180E|4304734312 [16265 |[Federal |Federal OW 'S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S |190E 4304739776 (17149 Federal |Federal GW |S




STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

FORM 9

5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

UTU-76482

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

®. IFINDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

1. TYPE OF WEL
Y owwew [J

GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:

9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10, FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDGAT-
7979 E. Tufts Ave. crry Denver s1are CO 580237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FooTAGES AT sURFAce: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL county: Uintah

QTR/AQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 108 18E S STATE: y

TAH
. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION _ TYPE OF ACTION
[ aciize [J oeeren [[] REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

2] nNoTiCE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) [ Arercasing

Approximate date work will start [[] casingrepar

4/16/2015

[] crance TueinG

[] suBseQUENTREPORT  |[T] cHaNce weLL NAME

(Submit Originat Form Only)

Date of work completion:

[C] converT weLL Type

[ cHance To PREVIOUS PLANS

[] cHance weLL sTaTUS
[C] COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS

[[] eracture TrReAT

[C] ~ewconsTRucTION

[/] oPeraTOR CHaNGE

[ Puucanp ABanDON

[ ruseack

[] ProDUCTION (STARTRESUME)

[J RecLAMATION OF WELL SITE

[C] RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

[[] sibETRACK TO REPAIR WELL
[J TeEmPORARILY ABANDON
] rtueinc Repair

[J venrorFLare

[ warter bisposaL

] waTER sHuT-OFF

1 omer:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11
Denver CO 80237

303-996-1805 M i

Michael Decker, Exec. Vice President & COO

Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite,115
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805 -

Michael Decker, Exec. Vicd President & COO

RECEIVED
JUN 02 2015

DIV, QF OIL, GAS & MINING

APPROVED

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) LjLndsey C°°ks rme Engineering Tech
SIGNATURE ‘ ( ﬁl@/ oate 9/18/2015
(This space for State use only)
JAN 2 2 2016
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

| V. OlL GAS & MINING -
BYWM\&



Well Name

FEDERAL 332-30-9-19

WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19

FEDERAL 12-17-9-19

GATE CYN 31-21-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15

WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16

WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08

GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17
RYE PATCH FED 22-21

RYE PATCH FED 24-21

RBU 5-11D

FEDERAL 7-25A

RBU 6-2D

NGC 33-18)

RBU 13-2D

RBU 16-3D

RBU 10-11D

RBU 8-10D

RBU 15-3D

RBU 12-12D

RBU 2-10D

RBU 3-15D

RBU 3-12D

STATE 7-36A

FEDERAL 34-29
FEDERAL 24-7 #1

FEDERAL 23-29 #1

FED 24-20-9-19

FED 44-20-9-19

FED 23-21-9-19

FED 32-31-9-19

FED 42-29-9-19

PETES WASH 23-12 #1

STATE 4-32B

FED 14-18-2 #1

FED 43-24-3 #1

LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19

FED 11-21-9-19

FED 22-30-10-18

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19

FED 11-22-9-19

FED 42-21-9-19

STATE 24-16-9-19

Section TWN
30 090S
29 1008
23 0908
26 0908
19 090S
17 090S
21 1108
32 1008
20 1108
17 1008
19 1108
32 1008
4 1108
32 1008
29 1008
16 1108
16 1008
29 1008
8 1108
16 1108
20 1008
20 1008
4 1108
22 1108
24 1108
11 1008
25 0908
2 1008
18 090S
2 1008
3 1008
11 1008
10 100S
3 1008
12 100S
10 1008
15 1008
12 1008
36 090S
29 0908
7 1008
29 090S
20 090S
20 090S
21 090S
31 090S
29 090S
12 1008
32 090S
18 1008
24 1008
22 0908
21 0908
30 1008
30 090S
22 090S
21 090S
16 090s

RNG
190E
170E
190E
180E
190E
190E
1S0E
170E
150E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
170E
150E
170E
170E
170E
160E
170E
170E
170E
140E
140E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
180E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
190E
170E
190E
180E
170E
190E
190E
180E
190E
190E
190E
190E

API

4304753012
4301333098
4304736915
4304738573
4304739777
4304739800
4301332391
4301332447
4301332475
4301332560
4301332611
4301332619
4301332674
4301332676
4301332679
4301332685
4301332730
4301332773
4301332778
4301332888
4301333081
4301333087
4301333099
4301333437
4301333443
4304730409
4304730624
4304731190
4304731200
4304731280
4304731352
4304731357
4304731364
4304731539
4304731651
4304731801
4304733600
4304733739
4304733741
4304733750
4304733983
4304734111
4304734168
4304734169
4304734199
4304734201
4304734202
4304734286
4304734314
4304734539
4304734551
4304734607
4304734608
4304734924
4304735343
4304735404
4304735405
4304735588

Entity
19650
15941
16556
17201
18344
17202
13787
14033
14417
14726
14439
15649
15537
15242
14033
16082
15243
15370
14802
15098
15714
15807
15920
16919
16367
9005

9030

7075

6155

16267
16268
7053

4955

9965

10688
10784
13213
14492
14244
13174
13182
13441
14150
14140
13601
13641
13455
13492
14440
13491
13726
13640
14151
14280
14202
14203
14928
14418

Mineral
Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
Federal
State

Surface Type

Federal
Federal
Fee
Federal
Federal
Federal
State
State
State
Federal
Federal
State
Federal
State
Federal
State
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FEDERAL 31-21-9-19
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19

LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19

DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18
STATE 12-32-9-19

FEDERAL 12-20-9-19
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19

DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18

SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19
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4304735606
4304735614
4304735623
4304735624
4304735732
4304735733
4304735808
4304735844
4304735845
4304735995
4304736093
4304736094
4304736095
4304736113
4304736219
4304736220
4304736233
4304736241
4304736242
4304736271
4304736336
4304736368
4304736442
4304736600
4304736719
4304736727
4304736739
4304736740
4304736771
4304736772
4304736817
4304736913
4304736916
4304737115
4304737116
4304737117
4304737132
4304737338
4304737611
4304737612
4304737613
4304737621
4304737622
4304737630
4304737631
4304737646
4304737647
4304737676
4304737677
4304738028
4304738336
4304738337
4304738351
4304738352
4304738353
4304738407
4304738465
4304738469
4304738575

14441
14442
14640
14419
14496
14519
15592
14356
14639
14871
14976
16120
14872
15096
14738
14763
14764
14992
14716
15884
15086
15605
15715
14977
15186
15475
15476
15213
15355
15338
15212
15187
17012
15011
16163
16275
15087
15365
16311
16051
16052
16253
16264
16557
15961
16023
16121
16254
15806
16868
16467
16119
16884
16349
16210
16236
16558
16449
16312
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LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18
STATE 21-32B

STATE 22-32A

STATE 21-32A

FEDERAL 11-19-9-19

SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID)
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19

Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18

22
11
32
32
32
19
25
25
I

19
30
19
30
30
30
36
36
36
36

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36

WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17
SQUAW CROSSING U §
RBU 4-11D

RBU 2-11D

RBU 6-11D

STATE 2-32B

STATE 9-36A
FEDERAL 13-30B
STATE 13-36A
FEDERAL 16-26A
FEDERAL 31-29

RBU 1-10D

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19

32
2

11
11
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30
36
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10
18
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4304738896
4304739170
4304739171
4304739172
4304739717
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4304739730
4304739773
4304740233
4304751280
4304751281
4304752870
4304752872
4304753011
4304753324
4304753325
4304753326
4304753327
4304753328
4301332677
4304730129
4304730718
4304730826
4304731192
4304732221
4304732225
4304733581
4304733598
4304733601
4304733653
4304734312
4304739776

15832
16792
16309
16308
16310
17054
17241
17266
17013
17014
18211
18210
19647
10648
19649
19783
19783
19747
19747
19783
15144
16266
16269
16270
16271
11371
11364
13249
17838
12928
13077
16265
17149

Fee
Federal
State
State
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Federal
Federal
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