
Form 3 I60-3 FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

U-68219

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER 6. IfIndiaryÁllotteeorTribeName
UT TRIBAL

la. Type of Work: DRILL O REENTER 7. IPUnit or CA Agreement, Name and No.CONFIDENTIAL /Ñ/A
'8. Lease Name and Well No.

Ib. Type of Well: O Oil Well Gas Well O Other Single Zone O Multiple Zo GYPSUM HILLS 13HG-17-8-21

2. Name of Operator Contact: JOHN BUSCH / 9. API Well No.
SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC, E-Mail: jbusch@shenandoahenergy.com

..

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 E. 175 S. Ph: 435.781.4341 UNDESIGNATED FIELD
VERNAL, UT 078 Fx: 435.781.4323

4. Location of Well Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 40, y -yg 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk. and Survey or Area

At surface SWSW 675FSL 661F
" W4/59/ 7 4 /603 Sec 17 T8S R21E MerSLB

Atproposedprod.zon SESE 660FSL 800FEL 4a.unt 9.4
14. Distance in miles and dire tion from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

7 +/- MlLES FROM O AY, UTAH UINTAH UT

15. Distance from proposed locat 1 to nearest property or 16. No. of Acr n Lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
lease line, ft. (Also to nearest . unit line, if any)

661' +/- 880.0 40.00

18. Distance from proposed location to rest well, drilling, 19. P sed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease,

1800' +/- 18 MD U-0969
5309 TVD

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KB, RT, GL, tc. /22.Approximate date work will start 23. Estimated duration
4682 KB 10 DAYS

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the req remen of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan. Item20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on N ional Forest System nds, the 5. Operator certification

SUPO shall be filed with the appropria Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.

25. Signature Name (Pri dflyped) Date
JOHN SCH 09/20/2002

Title

App ov

dRbAy
g a ure) Name (Printed/Typed) SEP23 2002 Date

Title Office DIVibiUNOF
OIL, GAS AND MINING

Application appro'Èloes not warrant or certify the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct
operations the o
Conditions o - r val, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S etion 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to ake to any department or agency of the United
States any fal fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Additional Operator Remarks (see next page)

Electronic Submission #14101 verified by the BLM Well Information System
For SHENANDOAH ENERGYINC., sent to the Vernal

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



TBS, R21E, S.L.B.&M. SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.
Well locotion, GH #13HG-17-8-21, locoted os
shown in the SW 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section 17. T8S,
R21E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utoh.

S88 14'W - 39.64 (G.L.O.)
S88°09'W

- 39.58 (G.L.O.)
BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK 2OEAM LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION 35,
T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE, QUADRANGLE,
UTAH, UlNTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP)

ci PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENf OF THE
-1 INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS

BEING 4697 FEET.

o

N1967
Brass Cap

196707' Ng
&oss CqaScattered Stones

o

SCALE
CERTIFICATE

THISIS TO ŒRTlFY THAT THEAB D FROM
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUAL SURVE ·ME MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SA •fkUE ANDd THEOffOfD ÑO/O a BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND 'GH // JHG- 17- 8-21

661, Dev. Ungraded Ûr0Und = 46Û 800'
-- -- - -- -- -SoiJ2Ñ"r

JotB6 ISTARED MVE
ON NO. 16

1967 to REVISED: 09-19-02 D.COXauss cap
d 7' H

ÜmuH ENGINEERING & RVEYINGSB9'32'49"W - 2644.92' (Meas.) SB9t?J'11"W - 264110' (Meas.) 1967
BS SOUTH 200 EAST -- VERNAL, UTAH 84078

(435) 789-1017
LEGEND: scALE DATESURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

1" = 1000 07-11-02 07-16-02
=

90° SYMBOL (NAD 83) PARTY REFERENCES
= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE =

40°07'03.59" (40.117664) D.A. J.A. D.COX G.L.O. PLAT
WEATHER RLEA = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE = 109°35'07.92"



Shenandoah Energy Inc.
U-GB #13HG-17-8-21

psma 14iO DRILLING PROGRAM

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation TMD TVD
Uinta Surface Surface
Green River 2519' 2519'
Mahogany Ledge 3384' 3384'
..Kick off depth 4825' 4825'
G1 Lime 5605' 5304'
TD (Green River) 8918' 5309'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas, or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation TMD TVD
Oil/Gas Green River 8919' 5309'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the State of Utah form OGC-
8-X is acceptable. If no flows are detected,samples will be submitted to the BLM along
with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits Valley
water right #36125 or where possible a fresh water line (poly pipe) will be laid in the
access road to each location to supply fresh water for drilling



Shenandoah Energy Inc.
etPOTM¢13HG-17-8-21
Û gho |-lills DRILLING PROGRAM

3. Surface Ownership
The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by the Ute Tribe.

4. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 3,000 psi W.P. Double Gate BOP or Single Gate BOP (schematic attached)

B. Functional test dail

C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psi/foot or 1500 psi, whichever is
greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed
the internal yield pressure of the casing.

D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 70 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing whichever is less. Tests shall be done at the time of installation, prior to
drilling out and weekly. All tests shall be for a period of 15 minutes

5. Casing Program
Depth Hole Size Csz Size Type Weight

Surface 500' 12-1/4" 9-5/8" K-55 361b/ft (new)
Intermediate 5533 MD 8-3/4" 7" J-55 - N-80 (First 500' & Last 500') (new)

(5300 TVD)
Production 8918' 7-7/8" 6-1/8" Complete as open hole with 2 7/8" tubing

from surface to 5500'

6. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - no

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Rotating Head -



Shenandoah Energy Inc.
INHN¢13HG-17-8-21

Og tw PH¡ t.s DRILLING PROGRAM

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when drilling
below 500').

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

7. Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromates will
be used. It is not intended to use oil in the mud, however, in the event it is used, oil
concentration will be less than 4% by volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 9.5
ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

8. Testing, logging and corine program

A. Cores - none anticipated

B. DST - none anticipated

Logging - Mud logging -4500 to TD
GR-SP-Induction
Neutron Density
MRI

C. Formation and Completion Interval: Green River interval, final
determination of completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation -- Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as



Shenandoah Energy Inc.
84·½¾ #13HG-17-8-21
6 YN wt 6 0 5 DRILLINGPROGRAM

9. Cementing Program

Casing Volume Type & Additives

Surface 285 sx Premium Plus single slurry mixed to 15.6ppg,
yield = 1.18 ef/sx. Fill to surface with 160 cf (285
sx) calculated. Tail plug used. Allowed to set under
pressure

Production 480 sx* Lead Lead/Tail oilfield type cement circulated in place .

452 sx* Tail Tail slurry: Extended Class "G" + gilsonite and
additives as required, mixed to 14.35 ppg, yield =

1.25 cf/sx. Fill to 5533' (±300'above top of Lower
Green River).
Cement Characteristics:
Lead slurry: Extended, Lite, Hi-fill + extender and
additives as required, mixed to 11.0 ppg, yield =

3.81 cf/sx. Fill to surface. Tail plug used. Allowed
to set under pressure.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and
across zones as required by the authorized officer to insure protection of natural
resources.

10. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 2123.60 psi. Maximum
anticipated bottom hole temperature is 140°
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SHENANDOAHENERGYINC.
GYPSUM HILLS#13HG-17-8-21

675' FSL, 661' FWL
660' FSL, 800 FEL

SWSW, SECTION 17, T8S, R21E
SESE, SECTION 17, TSS, R22E

UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # U-68219

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI- POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

1. Existing Roads:

The proposed well site is approximately 17 miles from Ouray, Utah.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads withina 2 - mile radius.

There will be no improvements made to existing access roads.

2. Planned Access Roads:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Wasatch Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 - Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.

4. Location of Existinq & Proposed Facilities:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Wasatch Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Refer to Topo Map D-forthe location of the proposed pipeline.

5. Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Wasatch Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24
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6. Source of Construction Materials:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Wasatch Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

7. Methods of Handlinq Waste Materials:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Wasatch Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Wasatch Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

9. Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drill pad cross-sections, cuts and fills
and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailerparking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access
roads.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please see Shenandoah energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Wasatch Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Township 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

11. Surface Ownership:

The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by:

Ute Tribe
PO Box 190
Ft. Duchesne, Utah 84026
(435) 781-4400

12. Other Information -

A Class Ill archaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology
Consultants. A copy of this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by
Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended
for this
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Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

John Busch
Red Wash Operations Rep.

Shenandoah Energy Inc.
11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4341

Certification:

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved

plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

Shenandoah Energy Inc. will be fully responsible for the actions of theirsubcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drillwill be furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all

construction and drilling operations.

I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drillsite and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently

exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be

performed by Shenandoah Energy Inc. its' contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this plan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. This statement is

subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

20-Sep-02
John Busch Date

Red Wash Operations
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Additional Operator Remarks:

Shenandoah Energy Inc. proposes to drill a well to 5309'TVD and 8918' TMD to test the Wasatch. If
productive, casing will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and abandoned
as per BLM and State of Utah requirements.

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Wasatch Formation Wells located in
Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated fields in Townships 07
and 08 South, Ranges 21 and 24 East.

See Onshore Order No. I attached

Please be advised that Shenandoah Energy Inc. agrees to be responsible under the terms and conditions of
the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No. U-0969. The principal is Shenandoah Energy Inc. via
surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR



WORKSHEET
AWLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 09/23/2002 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-34723

WELL NAME: GYPSUM HILLS 13HG-17-8-21

OPERATOR: SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC ( N4235 )

CONTACT: JOHN BUSCH PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4341

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SWSW 17 080S 210E

SURFACE: 0675 FSL 0661 FWL Tech Review Initials Date

BOTTOM: 0660 FNL 1250 FEL Engineering
UINTAH

GYPSUM HILLS ( 610 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: U-68219

SURFACE OWNER: 2 - Indian LATITUDE: 40.11771

PROPOSED FORMATION: GRRV LONGITUDE: 109.58495

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3.

Bond:Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit

(No.U-0969 )
Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2

. General ÁNortA
Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting: 460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

(No. 43-8496 )
Drilling Unit

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:(Date: )
Eff Date:

\Ñ Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: //-Ò \ AAÀQ

STIPULATIONS: - pfggp
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'I3S R21E

CYPAUM NFDALU-2

WONSITS
GYPSUM HILLS VALLEY, 2.

I NITHELD

WVFL 16W942:- -¯¯

silwi i- - wvawiss2i WVF1

WV WVFI 6G IML2l

JW 16 21 WVFU 21

7 21 I 21
wvrxr =r

GH 9W 1742 L

GYPSI.)M
HILLA UNIT I

IIIIIS "2 gi GH

M20 21
SRU I FII 11 IIII

CYPSUMHIIIß22 CYP5tM GH

GYPSI M Hill.5 19

CM culiw-2 rin.u.um CYPSIM OWrAs AS 12W21 21 4 quelwTio2
I 10( M.21 Hil1B19 Hillste NDI-54B HDSM g f.Yrsikkun

p IDW1942L t-n GH GR SFAGF£OACig CYP5l IJßl0

trwoes ow.sassi swsos21 mm2: EllJ CAUSE:178-19

DUCK Will MS 21 21 21

GYPSUM HD R

sees assi WONSITS VAI I EY I I

OPERATOR: SHENANDOAH ENERGY (N4235)

SEC. 17 TBS, R21E

FIELD: GYPSUM HILLS (002)

COUNTY: UINTAH

SPACING:R649-3-ll / DIRECTIONAL DRILLING . . .Utah OilGas and Mining
WELLS UNIT STATUS FIELD STATT)S

GASINJECTION EXPl.ORATORY ABANDONED

GAS ETORAGE GAS ETORAGE
ACnVE NNF PP OlL

- 1DCATION ABANDONU
NF SECONDARY C MSINED

NEW LOCATION PENDENG ENACTIVE
* PLUGGED & ABANDONED Pl OfL

PROPOSED* PRODUONG GAS PP GAS
STORAGE• PRODUCING OIL PP GEOTHERML

s $HLTT-IN GAS PP OIL TERMINATED

SHUT-1N OIL SECONDARY COUNTY BOUNDARY

X TEMP, ABANDONED TERMíNATED SECITON LINES

TEST WELL
TO¾¾5HIP LINES

& WATER INJECTION PREPARED BY: DIANA MASON
+ WATIR SUPPLY DATE: 24-JANUARY-2OO3
N WATER
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC.
11002 East 17500 South

Vemal, UT 84078
Phone: (435) 781-4300

Fax (435) 781-4329

September 26, 2002

Division of Oil, Gas ScMining
1594 W. N. Temple STE 1210
SaltLakeCity,UT 84114-5801

To Whom It May Concern:

In the absence of special orders of the Board, no portion of the horizontalintervalwithin the
potentiallyproductive formationshall be closer than six hundred-sixty(660)feetto a drillingor spacing
unit boundary,federallyunitized area boundary,uncommitted tract within a unit, or boundarylineof a
leasenot committed to the drillingof such horizontalwell. Please refer to the Oil and Gas
Conservation General rule R649-3-2.3.

Shenandoah Energy Inc. GHg 13HG-18-8-21complies with this rule. This lease#(U-68219) is under
Gypsum Hills Unit Agreement and all owners are committed under the Unit Agreement.There are no
additional owners within 460' at all points of the intended well bore.

If you haveany question please contact Raleen Searle@ (435) 781-4309.

Thank you,

RaleenSearle
RegulatoryAffairs Analyst

HECEIVED
SEP27 2002
DMSION OF

OIL, GAS AND



Form 3160-3
FORM APPROVED(August 1999)
OMBNo. 1004-0136STATES ExpiresNoveinoer30,2000DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Senal No.
U-68219

APPLICATION FOR PERMITTO DRILLOR REENTER 6. If Indian, AllotteecrTribeName
UTETRIBAL

la. Type of Work: DRILL O REENTER CO NFIDÈNTIAL 1 Muitor CA A en , Nanie BNo.

8. LeaseName and Well No.1b.Type of Well: Oil Well O Gas Well O Other E Single Zone O MultipleZone GYPSUM HILLS13HG-17-8-21
2. Name of Operator Comact: JOHN BUSCH 9. API ellNo.SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC, E-Mail:jbusch@shenandoahenergy.com
3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (includearea code) 10. FieldandPool, or Exploratory11002 E. 17500 S. Ph: 435,781.4341 UNDESlGNATEDFIELDVERNAL, UT 84078 Fx: 435.781.4323
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements. 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk. and Survey or Area

At surface SWSW 675FSL 661FWL Sec 17 TSS R21E Mer SLB
Atproposedprod.zone 889E 660FNL 1250FEL qq'I PS7 ( (di 678 Y -/04 5150 I14. Distance in miles and dife0tÊQILflOm20AtestaWSOP OSt OffiCC*

2 Coniñÿ õFFiirisli 13. StateT+RMí STROM OURAY, UTAH UlNTAH UT
15. Distance from proposed location to nearest property or 16. No. of Acres in Lease 17. SpacingUnit dedicated to this welllease line, ft. (Also to nearest drig.unit line, if any)661' +/- 880.00 40.00
18. Distance from proposed location to nearest well, drilling, 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on filecompleted, applied for, on this lease, ft.

1800' +/- 10286 MD UT-1237'
5321 TVD

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KB, RT, GL, etc. 22. Approximate date work will start 23. Estimatedduration4682 KB
10 DAYS

24. Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas OrderNo. 1, shall be attachedto this form:
1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bondto cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see2. A Drilling Plan. Item20 above).3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certificationSUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific informationand/or plans as may be requiredby theauthorized officer.

25. Signature Name (Printed/Typed) DateOHNBUSCH 01/09/2003
Title

OPERATIONS
roved Name (Printed/Typed)

.

- Date
BRADLEYG. HffI

.

--

office ENVIRONMENTALSCIENTISTIII
Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds legal or equitable title to thoserights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicantto conductoperations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212,make it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the UnitedStates any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Additional Operator Remarks (see next page)

Electronic Submission #17435 verified by the BLM Well Information SystemFor SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC., sent to the Vernal

REVISED
** ORIGINAL " ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL* ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL **

RECE1VED

JAN17 2003
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&Mt



TBS R21E, S.L.B.&M. SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.
' Well locotion, GH #13HG-17-8-21, located as

shown in the SW 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section 17, T8S,
R21E, S.L.B.&M, Uintah County, Utoh.

39.58 (G.L.O.)S88°14'W
- 39.64 (G.L.O.) BASIS OF ELEVATIONLl- \

- 0- 89°0r BENCH MARK 20EAM LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION 35,E (G.L.o.) T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE, QUADRANGLE,
UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP)

80/forn //0/ () PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE
C 1250' (Comp-) INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS

BEING 4697 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

o '
N1967

co ed Stones 6

,

¯o

-

°o

o o oo o - o

/ SCALE

CERTIFICATE
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE BY ME O RNDER MY
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME ARE TR UAÀIECf,)O THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BELIEF.

661 GH /1JHG-17-8-21
Elev. //ngraded Ground = 4668' o ED L S

- A REVISED: 01-08-03 D.COX

p
SB9°J249"W

- 2644.92' (Meas.) 903'11"W - 2643.10' (Meas.)

REVISED Op9- -O

OI E ING &
O 8

(435) 789-1017

LEGEND: SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:
1" = 1000' 07-11-02 07-16-02

=
90° SYMBOL (NAD 83) PARTY REFERENCES

, D.A. J.A. D.COX G.L.O. PLAT= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE =
40°07'03.59' (40.117664)

A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE =
109°35'07.92" (109.585533)

WEATHER
HOT

HEENANDOAH

ENERGY,



Shenandoah Energy Inc.
GHK13HG-17-8-21

DRILLING PROGRAM

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation TMD TVD
Uinta Surface Surface
Green River 2519' 2519'
Mahogany Ledge 3384' 3384'
..Kick off depth 4825' 4825'
Gl Lime 5605' 5187'
TD (Green River) 10,286' 5321'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil Gas Water and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas, or
other mineral bearing formations expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation TMD TVD
Oil/Gas Green River 10,286' 5321'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the State of Utah that form
OGC-8-X is acceptable. If no flows are detected, samples will be submitted to the BLM
along with any water analyses conducted. Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits
Valley water right #36125 or where possible a fresh water line (poly pipe) will be laid in
the access road to each location to supply fresh water for drilling



Shenandoah Energy Inc.
GHg 13HG-17-8-21

DRILLING PROGRAM

3. Surface Ownership
The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by the Ute Tribe.

4. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment:

A. 3,000 psi W.P. Double Gate BOP or Single Gate BOP (schematic attached)

B. Functional test daily

C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.2psi/foot or 1500 psi, whichever is
greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not exceed
the internal yield pressure of the casing.

D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to approved stack
working pressure if isolated by test plug or to 70 percent of internal yield pressure
of casing whichever is less. Tests shall be done at the time of installation, prior to
drilling out and weekly. All tests shall be for a period of 15 minutes

5. Casing Program
Depth Hole Size Csg Size Type Weight

Surface 500' 12-1/4" 9-5/8" K-55 361b/ft(new)
Intermediate 5533 MD 8-3/4" 7" J-55 - N-80 (First 500' & Last 500') (new)

(5300 TVD)
Production 10,286' 7-7/8" 6-1/8" Complete as open hole with 2 7/8" tubing

from surface to 5500'

6. Auxiliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - yes

B. Float at the bit - no

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually

D. Full opening safety valve on the rig floor - yes

E. Rotating Head -



Shenandoah Energy Inc.
GH 13HG-17-8-21 CONFlDENTlAL

DRILLING PROGRAM

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from the
well bore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. A continuous pilot (ignited when drilling below 500') shall provide Blooie line
ignition.

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold.

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of the
blooie lines for dust suppression.

7. Surface hole will be drilled with air, air/mist, foam, or mud depending on hole conditions.
Drilling below surface casing will be with water based drilling fluids consisting primarily
of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash and polymers. No chromate's
will be used. It is not intended to use oil in the mud, however, in the event it is used, oil
concentration will be less than 4% by volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 9.5
ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow Show will be used from base of surface casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used from surface casing depth to TD.

8. Testing, logging and coring program

A. Cores - none anticipated

B. DST - none anticipated

Logging - Mud logging -4500 to TD
GR-SP-Induction
Neutron Density
MRI

C. Formation and Completion Interval: Green River interval, final
determination of completion will be made by analysis of logs.
Stimulation - Stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest as



Shenandoah Energy Inc.
GHg 13HG-17-8-21

DRILLING PROGRAM V

9. Cementing Program

Casing Volume Type & Additives

Surface 285 sx Premium Plus single slurry mixed to 15.6 ppg,
yield = 1.18 ef/sx. Fill to surface with 160 ef (285
sx) calculated. Tail plug used. Allowed to set under
pressure

Production 480 sx* Lead Lead/Tail oilfield type cement circulated in place.
452 sx* Tail Tail slurry: Extended Class "G" + gilsonite and

additives as required, mixed to 14.35 ppg, yield =

1.25 cf/sx. Fill to 5533' (±300'above top of Lower
Green River).
Cement Characteristics:
Lead slurry: Extended, Lite, Hi-fill + extender and
additives as required, mixed to l1.0 ppg, yield =

3.81 cf/sx. Fill to surface. Tail plug used. Allowed
to set under pressure.

*Final cement volumes to be calculated from caliper log with an attempt to be made to
circulate cement to the surface. A bond log will be run across the zone of interest and
across zones as required by the authorized officer to insure protection of natural
resources.

10. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been encountered in
or known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the general area.
Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 4144.4 psi. Maximum
anticipated bottom hole temperature is 140°
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CONFil2TIAL

SHENANDOAHENERGYINC.
GYPSUM HILLS#13HG-17-8-21

675' FSL, 661' FWL
660' FNL, 1250' FEL

SWSW, SECTION 17, T8S, R21E
NÔNE, SECTION17, T8S, R2AE

UINTAHCOUNTY,UTAH
LEASE # U-68219

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI - POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONS PLAN

1. Existing Roads:

The proposed well site is approximately 17 miles from Ouray, Utah.

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 - mile radius.

There willbe no improvements made to existing access roads.

2. Planned Access Roads:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Green River Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 - Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.

4. Location of Existinq & Proposed Facilities:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Green River Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.

5. Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Green River Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.



e e CONRDENTIAL
6. Source of Construction Materials:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Green River Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Green River Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills,White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

8. Ancillary Facilities:

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Green River Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Townships 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

9. Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drillpad cross-sections, cuts and fills
and locations of the mud tanks, reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailerparking, spoil dirt
stockpile(s), and surface material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access
roads.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please see Shenandoah energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Green River Formation Wells
located in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in Township 07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 to 24 East.

11. Surface Ownership:

The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by:

Ute Tribe
PO Box 190
Ft. Duchesne, Utah 84026
(435) 781-4400

12. Other Information

A Class IIIarchaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology
Consultants. A copy of this report was submitted directlyto the appropriate agencies by
Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended
for this location.
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Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

John Busch
Red Wash Operations Rep.

Shenandoah Energy Inc.
11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4341

Certification:

All lease and/or unit operations willbe conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made withall applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved

plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

Shenandoah Energy Inc. willbe fully responsible for the actions of theirsubcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drillwillbe furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all

construction and drilling operations.

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently

exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be

performed by Shenandoah Energy Inc. its' contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with this plan and the termsand conditions under which it is approved. This statement is

subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

Jg g 09-Jan-03
John Busch Date

Red Wash Operations



Additional Operator Remarks:

Shenandoah Energy Inc. proposes to drill a well to 5321'TVDand 10286' TMD to test the Green River. If
productive, casing will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and abandoned
as per BLM and State of Utah requirements.

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for GreenRiver Formation Wells located
in Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, GypsumHills, White River, GlenBench, and undesignated fields in Townships
07 and 08 South, Ranges 21 and 24 East.

See Onshore Order No. 1 attached

Please be advised that ShenandoahEnergy Inc. agrees to be responsibleunder the terms and conditions of
the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No. UT-1237. The principal is Shenandoah Energy Inc.
via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC FICURE §2
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AFFIDAVIT

STATE OF UTAH

COUNTY OF UINTAH

John Busch, of lawful age, being first duly sworn, upon oath deposes and says:

THAT affiant is employed by Shenandoah Energy Inc. in the position
of Operations Representative and is familiar with company activity in the Uintah
Basin.

THAT affiant is familiar with the oil and gas mineral and leasehold
ownership in the following described land in the County of Uintah, State of
Utah, to wit:

Township 8 South, Range 21 East
Section 17: ALL

THAT Shenandoah Energy Inc. has proposed drilling the Gypsum Hills
Extension 13HG-17-8-21Horizontal well to be located in the section above
described on a temporary 640 acre spacing unit consisting of the governmental
section.

THAT Shenandoah Energy Inc. is the sole owner in the section above
described. (The use of the Word owner herein is a defined in R649-1 of the
Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, Oil and Gas General Rules.)

FURTHER affiant sayeth not.

John Busch

STATE OF UTAH

COUNTY OF UINTAH

Subscribed and sworn to before me this day of February, 2003.

My Commission expires:

&¾ 200 stata utaixotor the ·

Residing at 528 South 2375 West
Vernal, UT 84078

RAt:EENSEARu RECEIVEDNotary Pubile

My n
Eo ahJun

9.2004 FEB0 720035288 2375 W Vemat UT 84078-4000

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&
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( Stat of Utah

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
PO Box 145801

Michael O. Leavitt
Governor Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Robert L. Morgan (801) 538-5340 telephone
Executive Director (801) 359-3940 fax

Lowell P. Braxton (801) 538-7223 TTY
Division Director www.nr.utah.gov February 13, 2003

Shenandoah Energy Inc.
11002 E 17500 S
Vernal, UT 84078

Re: Gypsum Hills 13HG-17-8-21Well, Surface Location 675' FSL, 661' FWL, SW SW,
Sec. 17, T. 8 South, R. 21 East, Bottom Location 660' FNL, 1250' FEL, NE NE, Sec. 17,
T. 8 South, R. 21 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

Administrative approval for an exception location is hereby granted on the condition that
if the well is productive from the horizontal wellbore, the operator agrees to come before the
Board of Oil, Gas and Mining seeking appropriate spacing.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-34723.

ely,

ohn R. Baza
Associate Director

pb
Enclosures
cc: Uintah County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District Office

utah!
Where ideas
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Operator: Shenandoah Energy Inc.
Well Name & Number Gypsum Hills 13HG-17-8-21

API Number: 43-047-34723
Lease: U-68219

Surface Location: SW SW Sec. 17 T. 8 South R. 21 East
Bottom Location: NE NE Sec. 17 T. 8 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-l l, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit a
complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days
following completion of the
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Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

UTU68219

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER 6. IfIndian, Allotteeor TribeName

la. Type of Work: @ DRILL O REENTER CO NFIDENT IAL "'"""°r CA Agreement, Name and No.

8. Lease Name and Well No.

Ib. Type of Well: O Oil Well Gas Well O Other Single Zone O Multiple Zone GYPSUM HILLS 13HG-17-8-21

2. Name of Operator Contact: JOHN BUSCH 9. API Well No.
SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC E-Mail: john.busch@questar.com 43-047-34723-00-X1

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH Ph: 435.781.4341 UNKNOWN
VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 Fx: 435.781.4323

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk. and Survey or Area

At surface SWSW 675FSL 661FWL Sec 17 T8S R21E Mer SLB

Atproposedprod.zone NENE 660FNL 1250FEL

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State
7 +/- MILES FROM OURAY, UTAH UINTAH UT

15. Distance from proposed location to nearest property or 16. No. of Acres in Lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well
lease line, ft. (Also to nearest drig. unit line, if any)

661' +/- 880.00 40.00

18. Distance from proposed location to nearest well, drilling, 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, ft.

1800' +/- 10286 MD UT1237
5321 TVD

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KB, RT, GL, etc. 22. Approximate date work will start 23. Estimated duration
4682 KB 10 DAYS

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.

25. Signature Name (Printed/Typed) Date
(Electronic Submission) JOHN BUSCH 09/20/2002

Title
OPERATIONS

Approved by (Signature) Name (Printed/Typed) Date
(Electronic Submission) HOWARD B CLEAVINGER 11 03/04/2003

Title Office
AFM FOR MINERAL RESOURCES Vernal

Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct
operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Additional Operator Remarks (see next page)

Electronic Submission #14101 verified by the BLM Well Information System
For SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC, sent to the Vernal

RECEIVED Committed to AFMSS for processing by LESLIE WALKER on 10/01/2002 (03LWOOO2AE)

MARO52003
DIV.OFOIL,GM ** REVISED ** REVISED ** REVISED ** REVISED ** REVISED ** REVISED ** REVISED
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Additional Operator Remarks:

Shenandoah Energy Inc. proposes to drill a well to 5309'TVD and 8918' TMD to test the Wasatch. If
productive, casing will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and abandoned
as per BLM and State of Utah requirements.

Please see Shenandoah Energy Inc. Standard Operating Practices for Wasatch Formation Wells located in
Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated fields in Townships 07
and 08 South, Ranges 21 and 24 East.

See Onshore Order No. 1 attached

Please be advised that Shenandoah Energy Inc. agrees to be responsible under the terms and conditions of
the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is provided by Bond No. U-0969. The principal is Shenandoah Energy Inc. via
surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR
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Revisions to Operator-Submitted EC Data for APD #14101

Operator Submitted BLM Revised (AFMSS)

Lease: U-68219 UTU68219

Agreement: N/A

Operator: SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC. SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC

11002 E. 17500 S. 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH
VERNAL, UT 84078 VERNAL, UT 84078-8526
Ph: 435.781.4341 Ph: 435.781.4300
Fx: 435.781.4323 Fx: 435.781.4329

Admin Contact: JOHN BUSCH JOHN BUSCH
OPERATIONS OPERATIONS
11002 E. 17500 S. 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH
VERNAL, UT 84078 VERNAL, UT 84078-8526
Ph: 435.781.4341 Ph: 435.781.4341
Fx: 435.781.4323 Fx: 435.781.4323

E-Mail: jbusch@shenandoahenergy.com E-Mail: john.busch@questar.com

Tech Contact:

Well Name: GYPSUM HILLS GYPSUM HILLS
Number: 13HG-17-8-21 13HG-17-8-21

Location:
State: UT UT
County: UlNTAH UINTAH
S/T/R: Sec 17 T8S R21E Mer SLB Sec 17 T8S R21E Mer SLB
Surf Loc: SWSW 675FSL 661FWL SWSW 675FSL 661FWL

Field/Pool: UNDESIGNATED FIELD UNKNOWN

Bond: U-0969
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COAs Page 1 of 4
Well No.: GUPSUM HILLS 13HG-17-8-21

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: Shenandoah Energy Inc.

Well Name & Number: GYPSUM HILLS 13HG-17-8-21

API Number: 43-047-34723

Lease Number: UTU -- 68219

Surface Location: SWSW Sec. 17 TWN: 08S RNG: 22E

Bottom Hole Location: NENE Sec. 17 TWN: 08S RNG: 22E

Agreement: N/A

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval
for Notice to Drilland Surface Use
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COAs Page 2 of 4
Well No.: GUPSUM HILLS 13HG-17-8-21

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR NOTICE TO DRILL

Approval of thisapplication does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Submit an electronic copy of all logs run on this well in LAS format. This submission will
replace the requirement for submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

No other wells with a G1 Lime target in the Green River Formation will be allowed in the
NESW, SWNE, or the NENE of Section 17, Township 8 South, Range 21 East, Uintah
County, Utah.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well is
being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

A. DRILLINGPROGRAM

1. Casinq Proqram and Auxiliary Equipment

As a minimum, the usable water and oil shale resources shall be isolated and/or
protected by having a cement top for the production casing at least 200 ft. above the top
of the Green River Formation, identified at ±2,547 ft.

A casing integrity test must be run on the intermediate casing after the well is drilled prior
to initial completion of the well. Notify the BLM 24 hours prior to conducting the
casing integrity
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COAs Page 3 of 4
Well No.: GUPSUM HILLS 13HG-17-8-21

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL (COAs)

Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (Shenandoah) will assure the Ute Tribe that anylall contractors and
subcontractors have acquired a current Tribal Business License and have updated "Access
Permits" prior to construction. AllShenandoah personnel, contractors and subcontractors will
have these permits in theirvehicles at all times. Companies that have not complied with this
COA will be in violation of the Ute Tribal Business License Ordinance, and will be subject to
fines and penalties.

Shenandoah employees, representatives, and/or authorized personnel (subcontractors) shall not
carry firearms on their person or in their vehicles while working on the Uintah & Ouray Indian
Reservation.

Shenandoah employees and/or authorized personnel (subcontractors) in the field will have
approved applicable APDs and/or ROW permits/authorizations on their person(s) during all
phases of construction.

Shenandoah will notify the Ute Tribe and Bureau of Indian Affairs (BIA) in writing of any
requested modification of APDs or Rights-Of-Way (ROW). Shenandoah shall receive written
notification of authorization or denial of the requested modification. Without authorization,
Shenandoah will be subject to fines and penalties.

The Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Department shall be notified in writing 48 hours in advance of
any construction activity. The Ute Tribal office is open Monday through Thursday. A Tribal
Technician is to routinely monitor construction. Shenandoah shall make arrangements with the
Ute Energy & Minerals Department for all monitoring thatwillexceed regular working hours for
Tribal Technicians. A qualified Archaeologist accompanied by a Tribal Technician willmonitor
any trenchingconstruction of the pipeline. Shenandoah is to inform contractors to maintain
construction of the pipelines within the approved ROW.

A corridor ROW, 30 feet wide and 2614 feet long, was granted for the new access road for this
well. A pipeline route will be determined later and an approved route determined with BIA
approval prior to installation of the pipeline. The constructed travel width of the access road will
be limited to 18 feet. Upon authorization by the Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Department, the
ROW may be wider where sharp curves, deep cuts and fills occur; or, where intersections with
other roads are required. Culverts and diversion ditches will be placed and constructed where
needed. Road base gravel will be used where sandy soils make roadways and the drilling
location hazardous for access or drilling operations.

Upon completion of the pertinent APD and ROWs, Shenandoah will notify the Ute Tribe Energy
& Minerals Department for a Tribal Technician to verify the Affidavit of Completion. When each
pipeline has been constructed and completed as built descriptions will be filed with the Ute Tribal
Energy & Minerals Department.

Production waters, oil,and other byproducts shall not be placed on access roads or the well
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COAs Page 4 of 4
Well No.: GUPSUM HILLS 13HG-17-8-21

Allvehicular traffic,personnel movement, construction and restoration operations will be
confined to the areas examined and approved and to the existing roadways and/or evaluated
access routes.

Shenandoah will implement "Safety and Emergency Plan" and ensure plan compliance.

Shenandoah shall stop construction activities and notify personnel from the Ute Tribe Energy &
Minerals Department and BIA if cultural remains including paleontologic resources (vertebrate
fossils) are exposed or identified during construction. The Ute Tribe Department of Cultural
Rights and Protection and the BIAwill provide mitigation measures prior to allowing construction.

Shenandoah employees and/or authorized personnel (subcontractors) will not be allowed to
collect artifacts and paleontologic fossils. No significant cultural resources shall be disturbed.

Shenandoah will control noxious weeds on the well site and ROWs. Shenandoah will be
responsible for noxious weed control ifweeds spread from the project area onto adjoining land.

Reserve pits will be lined with an impervious synthetic liner to conserve fluids. A fence will be
constructed around the reserve pit until it is backfilled. Prior to backfilling the reserve pit, all
fluids will be pumped from the pit into trucks and hauled to approved disposal sites. When the
reserve pits are backfilled, the surplus oil and mud, etc., will be buried a minimum of 3 feet below
the surface of the soil.

A closed system will be used during production. This means that production fluids will be
contained in leak-proof tanks. All production fluids will be disposed of at approved disposal
sites.

Surface pipelines will be constructed to lay on the soil surface. The pipeline ROW will not be
bladed or cleared of vegetation without authorization of the BIA. Surface pipelines shall be
welded in place at well sites or on access roads and on other existing roads then pulled into
place with suitable equipment. Vehicles shall not use pipeline ROWs as access roads unless
specifically authorized.

Before the site is abandoned, Shenandoah will be required to restore the well site and ROWs to
near theiroriginal state. The disturbed areas willbe reseeded with desirable perennial
vegetation.

Soil erosion will be mitigated by reseeding all disturbed



Form 3160-5
(August 1999) ITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPAR . NT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Expires: November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS U-68219

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an
abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. IN/Indian,Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. IfUnit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
N/A

1. Type of Weli 8. Well Name and No.

O Oil Well gi Gas Well O Other
GYPSUM HILLS 13HG 17-8-21

2. Name of Operator Contact: DAHNF. CALDWELL 9. API Well No.
SHENANDOAHENERGY E-Mail: Dahn.Caldwell@questar.com 43-047-34723

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 E. 17500 S. Ph: 435.781.4342 UNDESIGNATED
VERNAL, UT 84078 Fx: 435.781.4357

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 17 TBS R21E SWSW 675FSL 661FWL UINTAHCOUNTY,UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Acidize O Deepen 0 Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off
0 Notice of Intent

O Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity
B Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete B Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon Well Spud

O Convert to Injection 0 Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 31604 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

This well was spud on 4/09/03. Drill12 1/4" hole to 484'KB. Ran 10 joints9-5/8" 36#csg to
470'KB.

This well's Surface Location 675' FSL, 661' FWL, SWSW, Sec 17, TSS, R21E, Bottom Location 660' FNL,
1250'FEL,NENE,Sec17,T8S,R21E.

APR22 2003

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #20763verifie by the BLM Well Information System

For SHENANDOAH ENRGY, sent to the Vernal

Na e(Printed/T ed) D HN F. CALD L
,

Title AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Signature c on i io Date 04/17/2003

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALOR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgved By_ Title Date

Condidons of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it acrime for anyperson knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

" ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL



0 11
State of Utah OPERATOR ACCT. No. N-4235
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: Shenandoah Energy, Inc.

ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South
ENTITY ACTION FORM - FORM 6 Vernal, Utah 84078-8526 (435)781-4300

Action Current New Entity API Number Well Name QQ SC TP RG County Spud Date Effective Date
Code Entity No.

No.
)¥ 43-047-34723 GH 13HG 17 8 21 SWSW 17 8S 21E UIntah 4/09/03

4 99999/8745 surra°• / s/d-3
WELL 1 COMMENTS:
New well to be drllied in Undesignated Field (Gy =sum Hills). Not in the Wasatch participating area. JU i IUL19 I IML

I | |
OLL 2 COMMENTS:

WELL 3 COMMENTS:

WELL4 COMMENTS:

WELL5 COMMENTS:

ACTIONCODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only)
B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unitwell) ,

i
C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity Si nature
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section) Clerk Specialist 4/17/03

Title Date
NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected

RIaqueþo. 4801) 781-4342
(3/89)

CONFŒ¾L APR22



O O
United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt LakeCity,UT 84145-0155

In Reply Refer To:
3106
(UT-924)

July 21, 2003

Memorandum

To: ernal Field Office

From: Chief, Branch of Minerals Adjudication

Subject: Name Change Approval

Attached is an approved copy of the name change from BLM-Eastern States, which is recognized
by the Utah State Office. We have updated our records to reflect:

The name change from Shenandoah Energy Incorporated into QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated is
effective July 23, 1999. The BLM Bond Number is ESB000024.

Acting Chief, Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. Eastern States Letter
2. List of leases

cc: MMS, James Sykes, PO Box 25165, M/S 357 B1, Denver CO 80225
State of Utah, DOGM, Earlene Russell (Ste. 1210), Box 145801, SLC UT 84114
Teresa Thompson (UT-922)
Joe Incardine (UT-921)

RECEIVED
JUL2 9 2003

DIV.OF OIL,GAS &
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.Exhibit of Leases

UTSL-065342 UTU-0825 UTU-65472 UTU-74971
UTSL-065429 UTU-0826 UTU-65632 UTU-74972
UTSL-066409-A UTU-0827 UTU-67844 UTU-75079
UTSL-066446 UTU-0828 UTU-68217 UTU-75080
UTSL-066446-A UTU-0829 UTU-68218 UTU-75081
UTSL-066446-B UTU-0830 UTU-68219 UTU-75082
UTSL-066791 UTU-0933 UTU-68220 UTU-75083
UTSL-069330 UTU-0971 UTU-68387 UTU-75084
UTSL-070932-A UTU-0971-A UTU-68620 UTU-75085
UTSL-071745 UTU-01089 UTU-69001 UTU-75086
UTSL-071963 UTU-02025 UTU-70853 UTU-75087
UTSL-071964 UTU-02030 UTU-70854 UTU-75088
UTSL-071965 UTU-02060 UTU-70855 UTU-75102

UTU-02148 UTU-70856 UTU-75103
UTU-046 UTU-02149 UTU-71416 UTU-75116
UTU-055 UTU-02510-A

.
UTU-72066 UTU-75243

UTU-057 UTU-09613 UTU-72109 UTU-75503
UTU-058 UTU-09617 UTU-72118 UTU-75678
UTU-059 UTU-09809 UTU-72598 UTU-75684
UTU-080 UTU-011225-B UTU-72634 UTU-76278
UTU-081 UTU-011226 UTU-72649 UTU-75760
UTU-082 UTU-011226-B UTU-73182 UTU-75939
UTU-093 UTU-012457 UTU-73443 UTU-76039
UTU-0116 UTU-012457-A UTU-73456 UTU-76482
UTU-0558 UTU-018260-A UTU-73680 UTU-76507
UTU-0559 UTU-022158 UTU-73681 UTU-76508
UTU-0560 UTU-025960 UTU-73684 UTU-76721
UTU-0561 UTU-025962 UTU-73686 UTU-76835
UTU-0562 UTU-025963 UTU-73687 UTU-77063
UTU-0566 UTU-029649 UTU-73698 UTU-77301
UTU-0567 UTU-65471 UTU-73699 UTU-77308
UTU-0568 UTU-65472 UTU-73700 UTU-78021
UTU-0569 UTU-103144 UTU-73710 UTU-78028
UTU-0570 UTU-140740 UTU-73914 UTU-78029
UTU-0571 UTU-14219 UTU-73917 UTU-78214
UTU-0572 UTU-14639 UTU-74401 UTU-78215
UTU-0629 UTU-16551 UTU-74402 UTU-78216
UTU-0802 UTU-28652 UTU-74407 UTU-80636
UTU-0803 UTU-42050 UTU-74408 UTU-80637
UTUO804 UTU-43915 UTU-74419 UTU-80638
UTUO805 UTU-43916 UTU-74493 UTU-80639
UTUO806 UTU-43917 UTU-74494 UTU-80640
UTUO807 UTU-43918 UTU-74495
UTUO809 UTU-56947 UTU-74496
UTUO810 UTU-65276 UTU-74836
UTU-0823 UTU-65404 UTU-74842
UTU-0824 UTU-65471



Fonn 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(June 1990) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires. March31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-68219

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT-" for such proposals 5. IfIndian, Allotteeor TribeName

N/A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA TE 7. If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well N/A
Oil Gas

Well WI Other 8. Well Name and No.

GHX13HG-17-8-21

2. Name of Operator

QEP UINTA BASIN INC. 9. APIWe11No.

3. Address and Telephone No 43-047-34723

11002E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 (801) 781-4309 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED

SWSW 675 FSL, 661 FWL, SECTION 17, T8S, R21E 11. countyorParish,State

UINTAH, UTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE 30X(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, 01. OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Intent Abandonment C oflm

Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Cmion to Ig n

Other METER INSTALLATION Dispose Water

(Note) Report results of multiplecompletion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Regrt and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, includingestimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)
QEP, Uintah Basin Inc. has installed a new Autograph meter to measure, make up the lease fuel being brought in to run the line heater for GHX 13HG-17-8-21.

Electric flow meter (Autograph) SN AO2J2010

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil,Gas and M\ning -.

14. I hereby certify that the f-o true d correct
signedRaleen Searle A

Title REGULATORY AFFARIS ANALYST Date 7/29/03

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent state
representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse Side

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



Form 3160-5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

ouneisso) DE MENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

B U OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 1993

5. Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU 68219

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 6. Ifindian, Allottee or Tribe Name

N/A

SUBMITIN TRIPLICA TE ' """"°r ca, Agreement Designation

1. Type of Well

Oil Gas

Well W1 Other 8 Well Name and No.

GH13HG17821
2. NameofOperator

QEP UINTA BASIN, INC. 9. API Well No.

3
Address and Telephone No. Contact: ann.petrik@questar.cOm 43-047-34723

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 435.781.4306 Fax 435.781.4329 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well(Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) UNDESIGNATED FIELD

SWSW, Sec 17, T8S, R21E 11. County or Parish, State

660' FSL, 1250' FEL UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, R OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice onntot Abandonment Change of Plans

O Recompletion New Construction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

O Casing Repair Water Shut-Off

Final Abandonment Notice Altering Casing Conversion to Injection

Other DOFP P"*"

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Report and Log form)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pertinent details, and give pertinent dates, includingestimated date of starting any proposed work If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

This well commenced production on 7/03/03.

RECEIVED

AU6052W3
3 - BLM, 2- Utah OG&M, 1 r, 1- file Word fil

DIVOFOIL,GAS&MINING

14. I bereby cen

e Authorized Representative Date 7/31/03

(This space for Fektate office use)

Approved by: Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, makes it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or
representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

*See instruction on Reverse Side



SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460)

Sec T R api DOGM type stat
WV l4W-4-8-21 04 080S 210E 4304734040 Federal GW APD C
WV 16W-4-8-21 04 080S 210E 4304734041 Federal GW APD C
WV 5W-36-7-21 36 070S 210E 4304734099 13807 State GW DRL C
WV 16W-31-7-22 31 070S 220E 4304734257 Federal GW APD C
RED WASH 16W-19-7-22 19 070S 220E 4304734258 Federal GW APD C
VVV97¥-16-7-21 16 070S 210E 4304734324 State (19/ AlND
GH 6W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734331 Federal GW APD C
YVV10TV-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734341 13766 Federal CON PA C
WV llW-23-8-21 23 080S 2l0E 4304734342 Federal GW APD C
VVV139V-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734344 Federal GY/ AlnD C
WV 14W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734345 Federal GW APD C
WV 15W-23-8-2l 23 080S 210E 4304734346 Federal GW APD C
WV 7W-31-7-22 31 070S 220E 4304734379 Federal GW APD C
WV 9W-30-7-22 30 070S 220E 4304734381 Federal GW APD C
WV 10W-25-7-21 25 070S 210E 4304734382 Federal GW APD C
WV 10W-26-7-21 26 070S 210E 4304734383 Federal GW APD C
WV 14W-30-7-22 30 070S 220E 4304734384 13750 Federal GW DRL C
WV 15W-27-7-21 27 070S 210E 4304734385 Federal GW APD C
GH 8W-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304734393 Federal GW APD C
SU PURDY 3W-30-7-22 30 070S 220E 4304734394 Federal GW APD C
STIRRUP UNIT 10G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734396 Federal OW APD C
WV 10W-35-7-21 35 070S 210E 4304734397 Federal GW APD C
WV 16G-6-8-22 06 080S 220E 4304734404 Federal OW APD C
SU 4W-26-7-21 26 070S 210E 4304734408 Federal GW APD C
STIRRUP U 12W-6-8-22 06 080S 220E 4304734449 Federal GW APD C
STIRRUP U 10W-6-8-22 06 080S 220E 4304734451 Federal GW APD C
STIRRUP U 8W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734453 Federal GW APD C
STIRRUP U 6W-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734454 Federal GW APD C
YVVID<T 107V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734561 13744 Federal (37V P C
STIRRUP U 7G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734609 Federal OW APD C
STIRRUP U 9G-5-8-22 05 080S 220E 4304734610 Federal OW APD C
STIRRUP U 9G-6-8-22 06 080S 220E 4304734611 Federal OW APD C
OU GB 10W-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304734616 State GW APD C
OU GB 14W-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304734619 State GW APD C
OU GB 16W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734633 Federal GW APD C
OU WIH 15W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734634 Federal GW APD C
OU GB 8W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734647 Federal GW APD C
OU GB 11W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734648 13822 Federal GW DRL C
OU GB 16W-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304734655 13815 State GW DRL C
OU GB lW-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304734656 State GW APD C
OU GB 8W-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304734660 13769 State GW DRL C
OU GB 3W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734677 Federal GW APD C
CRJ GB49V-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734685 13772 Federal G3N P C
OU WIH 2W-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734687 13837 Federal GW PA C
OU GB 9W-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304734692 State GW APD C
OU WIH lW-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734693 Federal GW APD C
CRJ GB 7G-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734694 Federal CI'N ikPD C
CRJ (IB 5(3-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734695 13786 Federal OVV P C
OU GB 8W-20-8-22 20 080S 220E 4304734706 Federal GW APD C
OU SG 14W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734710 13821 Federal GW DRL C
OU SG 15W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734711 13790 Federal GW DRL C
OU SG 169V-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734712 13820 Federal GV/ E)RL C
OU SG 4W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734713 13775 Federal GW DRL C
OU SG 12W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734714 13828 Federal GW DRL C
OU SG 5W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734715 Federal GW APD C
CRJ SG69V-l5-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734716 13865 Federal GVV P/t C
OU SG 8W-l5-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734717 13819 Federal GW DRL C

o&gdb n42350603.xls List#2 1



SEl (N423R5) toaC EP (NM246

type stat
CRJSG99V-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734718 13773 Federal GVV P C
CRJ SG 1½-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734720 Federal GAN APD C
OU SG 2W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734721 Federal GW APD C
OU SG 7W-l5-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734722 Federal GW APD C
GYPSUM HILLS 13HG-17- 17 080S 210E 4304734723 13765 Federal GW DRL C
OU GB 14SG-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734743 Federal GW APD C
OU GB 16SG-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734744 13771 Federal GW DRL C
CRJGB 139V-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734754 13774 Federal GY/ P C
04J GB 63¥-21-8-22 2l 080S 220E :4304734755 13751 Federal (INV P C
OU SG 10W-l0-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734764 Federal GW DRL C
DU SG 157V-10-8-22 10 080S 220E .4304734765 13849 Federal GV/ 1]FU- C
CRJCIB l49V-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734768 13781 Federal (19V P C

13U SG 169V-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734784 13777 Federal GV/ P C
I

OU GB 15G-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 64304734829 State .OW DRLI i i
BASER WASH 6W-7-7-22 07 070S 220E 4304734837 IFederal 'GW APD C
GB 5G-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734876 Federal OW APD C
GB 643-21-8-22 21 080S 220E 4304734882 Federal ()VV APl3 C
W IRON HORSE 2W-28-8-2 28 080S 220E 4304734883 Federal GW APD C
OU GB 8WX-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734884 Federal GW APD C
GB 7W-36-8-21 36 080S 210E 4304734893 State GW APD
GB 3W-36-8-21 36 080S 2l0E 4304734894 13791 State GW DRL
NC 8M-32-8-22 32 080S 220E 4304734897 State GW APD °

NC 3M-32-8-22 32 080S 220E 4304734899 State GW APD
N DUCK CREEK 3M-27-8-5 27 080S 2l0E 4304734900 Federal GW APD C
N DUCK CREEK 9M-22-8-5 22 080S 210E 4304734901 Federal GW APD C
N DUCK CREEK l IM-22-8 22 080S 210E 4304734902 Federal GW APD C
NDC 10W-25-8-21 25 080S 210E 4304734923 Federal GW APD C
GB 5W-36-8-21 36 080S 210E 4304734925 13808 State GW DRL
GB 4W-36-8-2l 36 080S 210E 4304734926 State GW APD
WV EXT lW-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734927 Federal GW APD C
TVVE)CT 89V-17-8-2l 17 080S 210E 4304734929 13792 Federal (INV DRL C
N13C llMl-27-8-2l 27 080S 210E 4304734952 13809 Federal (39V DRL C
NDC 9M-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734956 Federal GW APD C
NDC 1M-27-8-21 27 080S 210E 4304734957 Federal GW APD C
NDC 15M-28-8-21 28 080S 210E 4304734958 Federal GW APD C
NC lllW-32-8-22 32 080S 220E 4304735040 State (39V knENV
RED WASH U 34-27C 27 070S 240E 4304735045 Federal GW APD C
WRU ElH 10W-35-8-22 35 080S 220E 4304735046 13544 Federal GW DRL C
WRU EIH 9W-26-8-22 26 080S 220E 4304735047 Federal GW APD C
WRU EIH 15W-26-8-22 26 080S 220E 4304735048 Federal GW APD C
WRU EIH lW-35-8-22 35 080S 220E 4304735049 Federal GW APD C
WRU EIH 9W-35-8-22 35 080S 220E 4304735050 Federal GW APD C
WRU EIH 7W-35-8-22 35 080S 220E 4304735051 Federal GW APD C
WRU EIH 2W-35-8-22 35 080S 220E 4304735052 Federal GW APD C

o8tg db n4235 0603.xls List#2 2



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET .1. GLH
2. CDW
3. FILE

0 1 4
Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N4235-Shenandoah Energy Inc N2460-QEP Uinta Basin Inc

11002E 17500S 11002E 17500S
Vernal, UT 84078-8526 Vernal, UT 84078-8526

Phone: (435) 781-4341 Phone: (435) 781-4341

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL Confid

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

BASER WASH 6W-7-7-22 07 070S 220E 4304734837 Federal GW APD C
GYPSUM HILLS 13HG-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734723 13765 Federal GW DRL C
OU GB 13.W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734754 13774 Federal GW P C
OU SG 10W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734764 Federal GW DRL C
OU SG 15W-10-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734765 13849 Federal GW DRL C
OU GB 14W-l0-8-22 10 080S 220E 4304734768 13781 Federal GW P C
OU SG 16W-10-8-2 10 080S 220E 4304734784 13777 Federal GW P C
OU SG 8W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734717 13819 Federal GW DRL C
OU SG 9W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734718 13773 Federal GW P C
OU SG l W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734720 Federal GW APD C
OU SG 2W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734721 Federal GW APD C
OU SG 7W-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734722 Federal GW APD C
GB 5G-15-8-22 15 080S 220E 4304734876 Federal OW APD C
OU GB 15G-16-8-22 16 080S 220E 4304734829 State OW DRL
OU GB 6W-21-8-22 2l 080S 220E 4304734755 1375l Federal GW P C
GB 4G-21-8-22 2l 080S 220E 4304734882 Federal OW APD C
W IRON HORSE 2 28-8-22 28 080S 220E 4304734883 Federal GW APD C
OU GB 14SG-29-8-5 29 080S 220E 4304734743 Federal GW APD C
OU GB 16SG-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734744 13771 Federal GW DRL C
OU GB 8WX-29-8-22 29 080S 220E 4304734884 Federal GW APD C

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2003

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/19/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5292864-0151

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

OEP UB 28 FORM
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6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 7/21/2003

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 7/21/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,

for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 9/11/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 9/11/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: n/a

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: n/a

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965-003-032

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-l) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965-003-033

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP UB 28 FORM
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. Jim Simonton

From: Kevin OConnell

Sent: Monday, August 04, 2003 3:47 PM
To: Raleen Searle; Dahn Caldwell
Cc: John Busch; Green River Team; Jim Simonton
Subject: GHX13HG-17-8-21 ( Bottomhole Location)

Folks,
I am sending over a summary report that Weatherford prepared on the directional

drilling of this G-1 Horizontal well. Some of it may be needed to submit with the
completion reports for this well. Below is what I have calculated for 2 major points in
the well (Bottom of 7" casing & Total Depth):

Surface Location: 675' FSL x 661' FWL, SW SW of Section 17 -- T8S- R21E

1) 7.00-inch Casing shoe depth 5800' MD (measured Depth) , 5320.63 TVD (true vertical
depth), approx 88-degree inclination.

Referenced to surface location/wellhead the casing shoe is 698.9 feet North and
918.5 feet East of surface.

Referenced to the SW corner of Section 17, this same point, the casing shoe is
located 1373.9 feet FSL ( from South line) and 1579.50 feet FWL ( from West Line).

2) Total Depth: the 6-1/8 inch open hole goes from 5800' to 7159' MD. The well was TD'd
at 7159' MD, which is 5312' TVD.

Referenced to the surface location/welIheacI the end of the well is 1787.8 feet
North and 1400.2 feet East of surface.

Referenced to the SW corner of Section 17 (and this is what I assume you need
for the completion report) the end of the well is located 2462.8 feet FSL ( From South
Line) and 2061.2 feet FWL (from West Line), which is in the
NEl4 of NEl4 of SWl4 of Section 17-T8S-R22E.

Please call with any questions.

Kevin E. O'Connell
QuestarE & P
w:303-308-3059
c:303-883-4124
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FIELD: Undesignated GL: 466, KBE:4691' Spud date: 4-10-03 Completion L a. 7/7/2003

WELL NAME: GHX 13HG-17-8-21 TVD: 5312' MD:7159' Current Well Status: Pumping Oil Well - Horizontal G-1 Lime

Location at surface: SWSW Sec. 17, T8S, R21E Reason for PulllWorkover:

Wellbore
Schematic Tubing Landing Detail:

Description Size Footage Depth

Surface casing
Size: 9-5/8" KB 22.50 22.50

Weight: 36# Stretch 1.25 23.75

Grade J-55 150 jts tubing 2-7/8" 4716.75 4740.50

Cemented TAC 7" 2.34 4742.84

wl175 sks 10' pup jt. 2-7/8" 10.15 4752.99

Set @470' PSN 2-7/8" 1.10 4754.09

Hole size 12 1/4"
_

1 jt. 2-7/8" 31.36 4785.45

4' perfpup 2-7/8" 4.06 4789.51

6' pup 2-7/8" 6.03 4795.54
Pinned collar 2-7/8" 0.45 4795.99

TOC - unknown EOT 4795.99

No bond log run. Tubing Information
EXCLUDED PERFS OPEN PERFS Condition:

New: X Used: Rerun:

Grade: J-55

Weight (#lft): 6.50

Sucker Rod Detail:
Size Rods Type

1-1/2" x 26' polishrod
1-2' 2 - 6' x 7/8" ponies
87 - 7/8" plain
90 - 3/4" plain

10 - 3/4" guided

Rod Information
Condition:
New: x USED _RERUN
Grade: High strength
Manufacture: Weatherford

Pump Information:
API Designation 2-1/2" x 1-3/4" x 20 x 21 x 21-1/2" RHAC w/180" stroke

Example:
Pump SN#: 1439 Original Run Date: 7/3/2003

RERUN NEW RUN X

ESP Well Flowing Well

Cable Size: "R" NIPPLE
Pump Intake @ ' PKR @
End of Pump @ ' EOT @
Wellhead Detail:
7 1/16" 2000#
7 1/16" 3000# X
7 1/16" 5000#

TAC @ 4743' Other:
HANGERYES No X

PSN @ 4754' Summary
Initialcompletion: RIH w/bit, bit sub w/float &2-7/8" tubing. Drilled up composite BP
4500'. Plug fell free. RIH to 5762' MD & circulate clean. POOH & LD bit. RIH with

EOT @ 4796' productiontubing& landed. Run pump & rods, test & turnto production.

12/8/03 BROKE PLOISH ROD, Fished, Ran 26' added a 2' pony (RGD )

Kick off point - 5320'

Drilled 1240' @
90 degree angle.

Production casing Open hole completion.

Size: 7" 1

Weight: 23#
Grade L-80 & N-80 I
Cemented I

w/655 sks
Set @5800' MD, i

Hole size 8-3/4"

Prepared By: J. Pennell Date:



0 e CONFilENTlä
Today's Date : 2/2/2004

PERC DIRECTIONAL REPORT

WELLNAME: GHX13HG-17-8-21

FIELD: UNDESIGNATED WELL ID NO.: UTO8852001

AFE NO.: 18932 API NO.: 43-047-34723

SURVEY TYPE : MWD-0 MD : ANGLE : AZIMUTH : TVD :

NIS : ElW : VS : TARGET :

MEASURED INCLINATION AZIMUTH TVD +NORTH +EAST VERTICAL DOGLEG

DEPTH ANGLE ANGLE -SOUTH -WEST SECTION SEVERITY

0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

0 0.00 0.00 0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

23 1.80 32.80 23 0.31 0.20 0.31 7.67

47 7.30 43.90 47 1.72 1.46 1.72 23.17

53 52.90 41.70 52 3.66 3.20 3.66 854.04

83 78 13.40 11.88 13.40 174.30

524 0.40 160.40 519 11.95 12.40 11.95 0.09

646 0.60 77.10 641 11.69 13.16 11.69 0.56

769 1.40 73.50 764 12.26 15.23 12.26 0.65

2,146 2.10 31.10 2,140 38.64 44.39 38.64 0.10

2,348 1.80 32.80 2,342 44.48 48.02 44.48 0.15

2,780 1.50 308.00 2,774 53.66 47.24 53.66 0.52

2,875 1.70 297.70 2,869 55.08 45.02 55.08 0.37

2,971 2.40 322,50 2,965 57.34 42.53 57.34 1.16

3,160 2,60 314.50 3,154 63.49 37.06 63.49 0.21

3,287 1.70 335.50 3,281 67.22 34.23 67.22 0.93

3,414 2.60 11.60 3,408 71.75 34.03 71.75 1.25

3,603 3,50 33.00 3,596 80.79 38.03 80.79 0.76

3,666 3.20 30.50 3,659 83.92 39.97 83.92 0.53

3,793 3,50 36.60 3,786 90.09 44.08 90.09 0.37

3,857 4.00 37.60 3,850 93.42 46.61 93.42 0.79

3,919 4.40 38.50 3,912 97.00 49.41 97.00 0.65

3,982 4.10 39.90 3,975 100.62 52.36 100.62 0.50

4,110 4.40 51.50 4,102 107.18 59.13 107.18 0.71

4,173 4.40 53.00 4,165 110.14 62.96 110.14 0.18

4,237 4.50 48.20 4,229 113.29 66.79 113.29 0.60

4,300 4.60 41.80 4,292 116.83 70.31 116.83 0.82

4,363 5.10 35.70 4,354 120.98 73.63 120.98 1.14

4,426 5.60 35.10 4,417 125.77 77.03 125.77 0.80

4,489 4.80 38.80 4,480 130.34 80.45 130.34 1.38

4,552 4.80 48.10 4,543 134.16 84.07 134.16 1.23

4,615 5.50 49.80 4,605 137.86 88.33 137.86 1.14

4,679 6.70 46.90 4,669 142.40 93.40 142.40 1.94

4,741 7.30 43.90 4,731 147.70 98.78 147.70 1.13

4,772 7.90 45.10 4,761 150.63 101.65 150.63 2.00

4,802 8.20 44.80 4,791 153.60 104.62 153.60 1.01

4,834 10.60 46.40 4,823 157.25 108.36 157.25 7.54

4,865 14.60 47,48 4,853 161,86 113.30 161.86 12.93

4,897 19.30 48.30 4,883 168,11 120.23 168,11 14.71

4,928 24.40 49.50 4,912 175,68 128.93 175.68 16.51

4,960 29.00 51.70 4,941 184,78 140.05 184.78 14.70

4,992 32.90 51.10 4,968 195,05 152.90 195.05 12.23

5,023 35.70 49.10 4,994 206.26 166.30 206.26 9.74

5,055 37.60 48.40 5,019 218.86 180.66 218.86 6.08

5,086 40.00 47.60 5,044 231.86 195.09 231.86 7.91

5,118 42.40 46.70 5,068 246.20 210.54 246.20 7.73

5,150 44.70 45.50 5,091 261.48 226.42 261.48 7.64

5,181 47.40 44.00 5,112 277.34 242.12 277.34 9.38

5,212 49.10 43.00 5,133 294.11 258.04 294.11 5.99

5,244 51.10 41.60 - 5,154 312.27 274.56 312.27 7.09

5,275 52.90 41.70 5,173 330.53 290.79 330.53 5.81

5,307 54.20 43.80 5,192 349.42 308.26 349.42 6.66

5,339 56.40 45.50 5,210 368.13 326.76 368.13 8.14

5,370 58.70 45.80 5,227 386.42 345.46 386.42 7.46

5,402 61.40 44.90 5,243 405.90 365.18 405.90 8.78

5,434 64.20 44.70 5,257 426.10 385.23 426.10 8.77

5,435 63.52 46.43 5,258 426.73 385.88 426.73 169.54

5,465 67.40 44.60 5,270 445.85 405.34 445.85 14.07
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Today's Date : 2/2/2004

DIRECTIONAL REPORT

WELLNAME: GHX13HG-17-8-21

FIELD: UNDESIGNATED
WELL ID NO.: UTO8852001

AFE NO,: 18932
API NO.: 43-047-34723

URVEY T E : MWD-0 MD : ANGLE : AZIMUTH : TVD :

NIS : E/W : VS :
TARGET :

MEASURED INCLINATION AZIMUTH TVD +NORTH +EAST VERTICAL DOGLEG

DEPTH ANGLE ANGLE -SOUTH -WEST SECTION SEVERITY

5,497 71.30 44.70 5,281 467.15 426.38 467.15 12.19

5,529 75.30 44.60 5,291 488.95 447.91 488.95 12.50

5,561 79.30 42.70 5,298 511.53 469.45 511.53 13.78

5,571 79.80 41.60 5,299 518.82 476.05 518.82 11.92

5,581 80.30 40.40 5,301 526.26 482.51 526.26 12.83

5,592 80.80 39.20 5,303 534.59 489.46 534.59 11.68

5,602 81.40 38.00 5,304 542,31 495.62 542.31 13.29

5,612 82.20 37.00 5,306 550.17 501.65 550.17 12.73

5,624 83.10 35.80 5,307 559.74 508,71 559.74 12.43

5,629 83.60 35.30 5,308 563.79 511.59 563.79 14.09

5,656 86.40 32.80 5,310 586.07 526.65 586.07 13.88

5,687 89.00 29.60 5,312 612.56 542.69 612.56 13.29

5,719 87.70 29.10 5,312 640.44 558.37 640.44 4.35

5,735 87,00 29.00 5,313 654.41 566.13 654.41 4.42

5,772 87.00 29.00 5,315 686.73 584.05 686.73 0.00

5,800 89.70 29.00 5,316 711.20 597.61 711.20 9.64

6,011 87.50 31.60 5,321 893.30 704.02 893.30 1.61

6,043 88.80 32.70 5,322 920.38 721.04 920.38 5.32

6,071 89.00 36.10 5,323 943.47 736.85 943.47 12.16

6,103 89.90 36.40 5,323 969.28 755.77 969.28 2.96

6,134 91.20 35.30 5,323 994.40 773.93 994.40 5.49

6,386 90.00 34.10 5,320 1,201.56 917.37 1,201.56 0.67

6,418 87.50 33.90 5,321 1,228.09 935.26 1,228.09 7.84

6,575 89.60 34.20 5,325 1,358.12 1,023.13 1,358.12 1.35

6,606 89.80 34.40 5,325 1,383.73 1,040.60 1,383.73 0.91

6,794 90.00 34.70 5,325 1,538.57 1,147.22 1,538.57 0.19

6,826 89.90 34.90 5,325 1,564.85 1,165.49 1,564.85 0.70

6,858 90.50 38.10 5,325 1,590.57 1,184.52 1,590.57 10.17

6,889 89.70 37.30 5,325 1,615.09 1,203.47 1,615.09 3.65

6,921 87.90 39.00 5,326 1,640.25 1,223.23 1,640.25 7.74

6,952 89.40 40.60 5,327 1,664.06 1,243.07 1,664.06 7.07

6,983 91.70 41.00 5,326 1,687.52 1,263.33 1,687.52 7.53

6,995 93.20 40.90 5,326 1,696.58 1,271.18 1,696.58 12.53

7,005 94.50 41.60 5,325 1,704.08 1,277.76 1,704.08 14.76

7,015 96.00 42.30 5,324 1,711.49 1,284.42 1,711.49 16.54

7,025 97.10 43.00 5,323 1,718.79 1,291.15 1,718.79 13.01

7,035 97.80 43.90 5,322 1,725.99 1,297.97 1,725.99 11.34

7,047 98.80 44.40 5,320 1,734.51 1,306.24 1,734.51 9.30

Page 2
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00NFllENTIAL
Job Number: WYLO603DHO31 State/Country: Utah,Uinta

Company: Questar Declination: 12.3

Lease/Well: GHX-13HG-17-8-21 Grid: Elevation 6000

Location: Sec 17-T8S-R21E Filename: C:\WINSERVE\WYOMING\QUESTAR\GHX-13HG. A

Weatherfori Rig Name: Caza 24 DatelTime: 22-Jun-03 I13:37

RKB:SHL: 875 FSL& 661 FWL Sec 17 Curve Name: WORK-OPENHOLE ST#1

e G.L. or M.S.L.: BHL660 FNL& 1250 FEL Sec 17

WINSERVE SURVEY CALCULATIONS
MinimurnCurvature IVIethod

Vettical Section Plane 40.50
Verfical Section Referenced to Wellhead

Rectangular Coordinates Referenced to Wellhead

Measured IncI Drift True Vertical Course BUILD WALK Dogleg TFO
Depth Angle Direction Vertical N-S E-W Section Length RATE RATE Severity

FT Deg Deg Depth FT FT FT FT Deg/100 Deg/100 Deg/100 Deg

5735.00 87.00 29.00 5318.01 642.17 564.37 854.84 16.00 -4.38
-.62 4.42 .00

5772.00 87.00 29.00 5319.95 674.49 582.28 891.04 37.00 .00 .00 .00
-12.09

5818.00 88.40 28.70 5321.79 714.74 604.46 936.06 46.00 3,04 -.65 3.11 140.27
5849.00 86.00 30,70 5323.31 741.64 619.79 966.47 31.00 -7.74 6.45 10.07 101.23
5881.00 85.20 34.80 5325.76 768.47 637.05 998.08 32.00 -2.50 12.81 13.02 52.71

5913.00 86.80 36.90 5328.00 794.34 655.74 1029.89 32.00 5.00 6.56 8.24 4.08
5945.00 88.20 37.00 5329.39 819.89 674.96 1061.80 32.00 4.38 .31 4.39 -9.46

5977.00 89.40 36.80 5330.06 845.47 694.17 1093.73 32.00 3.75 -.62 3.80 -14.04

6008.00 90.20 36.60 5330.17 870.32 712.70 1124.66 31.00 2.58 -.65 2.66 161.56
6040.00 89.90 36.70 5330.14 896.00 731.80 1156.59 32.00 -.94

.31 .99

-146.31

6071.00 89.00 36.10 5330.44 920.95 750.19 1187.51 31.00 -2.90 -1.94 3.49 18.44
6103.00 89.90 36.40 5330.75 946.75 769.11 1219.42 32.00 2.81 .94 2.96 -68.20

6134.00 90.50 34.90 5330.64 971.94 787.18 1250.30 31.00 1.94 -4.84 5.21 7.12
6166.00 92.10 35.10 5329.91 998.15 805.53 1282.15 32.00 5.00 .62 5.04 7.12
6197.00 92.90 35.20 5328.56 1023.47 823.36 1312.98 31.00 2.58 .32 2.60 -152.44

6229.00 90.60 34.00 5327.58 1049.80 841.52 1344.80 32.00 -7.19 -3.75 8.11 177.51
6261.00 88.30 34.10 5327.89 1076.31 859.44 1376,59 32,00 -7.19 .31 7,19 -144.01

6292.00 87.20 33.30 5329.11 1102.08 876.62 1407.35 31.00 -3.55 -2.58 4.39 15.43
6323.00 90.10 34.10 5329.84 1127.86 893.82 1438.12 31.00 9.35 2.58 9.70 .00

6354.00 90.90 34.10 5329.57 1153.53 911.20 1468.92 31.00 2.58 .00 2.58 180.00

6386.00 90.00 34.10 5329.32 1180.02 929.14 1500.72 32.00 -2.81
.00 2.81 -175.43

6417.00 87.50 33.90 5329.99 1205.71 946.46 1531.51 31.00 -8.06 -.65 8.09 -139.45
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Measured Incl Drift True Vertical Course BUILD WALK Dogleg TFO

Depth Angle Direction Vertical N-S E-W Section Length RATE RATE Severity

FT Deg Deg Depth_ FT FT FT FT Deg/100 Deg/100 Deg/100 Deg

6449.00 86.80 33.30 5331.58 1232.33 964.15 1563.24 32.00 -2.19
-1.87 2.88 5.71

6481.00 88.80 33.50 5332.81 1259.03 981.75 1594.97 32.00 6.25 .62 6,28 19.29

6512.00 90.80 34.20 5332.92 1284.77 999.02 1625.76 31.00 6.45 2.26 6.84 180.00

6543.00 90.30 34.20 5332.62 1310.41 1016.44 1656.57 31.00 -1.61
.00

1.61 180.00

6575.00 89.60 34.20 5332.65 1336.88 1034.43 1688.38 32.00 -2.19
.00

2.19 45.00

6606.00 89.80 34.40 5332.81 1362.49 1051.90 1719.20 31.00 .65
.65 .91

56.31

6638.00 90.20 35.00 5332.81 1388.79 1070.12 1751.03 32.00 1.25 1.87 2.25 -153.43

6670.00 89.80 34.80 5332.81 1415.04 1088.42 1782.88 32.00 -1.25
-.62 1.40 -153.44

6701.00 89.60 34.70 5332.98 1440.51 1106.09 1813.72 31.00 -.65
-.32

.72 23.96

6731.00 91.40 35.50 5332.71 1465.05 1123.34 1843.59 30.00 6.00 2.67 6.57 143.13

6763.00 91.00 35.80 5332.04 1491.05 1141.99 1875.46 32.00 -1.25 .94 1.56 -132.27

6794.00 90.00 34.70 5331.77 1516.36 1159.88 1906.33 31.00 -3.23
-3.55 4.80 167.47

6826.00 89.10 34.90 5332.02 1542.64 1178.14 1938.17 32.00 -2.81 .63 2.88 66.38

6858.00 90.50 38.10 5332.14 1568.36 1197.17 1970.09 32.00 4.38 10.00 10.91 -135.00

6889.00 89.70 37.30 5332.08 1592.89 1216.13 2001.05 31.00 -2.58
-2.58 3.65 136.66

6921.00 87.90 39.00 5332.75 1618.04 1235.89 2033.02 32.00 -5.62 5.31 7.74 46.86

6952.00 89.40 40.60 5333.48 1641.85 1255.73 2064.00 31.00 4.84 5.16 7.07 9.86

6983.00 91.70 41.00 5333.18 1665.32 1275.98 2095.00 31.00 7.42 1.29 7.53 -3.81

6995.00 93.20 40.90 5332.67 1674.37 1283.84 2106.99 12.00 12.50 -.83 12.53 28.22

7005.00 94.50 41.60 5332.00 1681.87 1290.42 2116.96 10.00 13.00 7.00 14.76 24.89

7015.00 96.00 42.30 5331.09 1689.28 1297.07 2126.92 10.00 15.00 7.00 16.54 32.26

7025.00 97.10 43.00 5329.94 1696.58 1303.80 2136.85 10.00 11.00 7.00 13.01 51.83

7035.00 97.80 43.90 5328.65 1703.78 1310.62 2146.75 10.00 7.00 9.00 11.34 26.29

7047.00 98.80 44.40 5326.92 1712.30 1318.89 2158.60 12.00 8.33 4.17 9.30 73.08

7079.00 99.60 47.10 5321.80 1734.34 1341.52 2190.05 32.00 2.50 8.44 8.70 147.80

7099.00 98.50 47.80 5318.65 1747.70 1356.07 2209.66 20.00 -5.50 3.50 6.50 180.00

PROJECTION TO BIT AT TD 7159 MD

7159.00 93.50 47.80 5312.38 1787.77 1400.26 2268.83 60.00 -8.33 .00 8.33 180.00

Page 2
WORK-OPENHOLE ST#1 File:



Form 31&)-4
Form approved.

(November 1983) UNIT ATES SUBMIT IN DUPLICA Budget Bureau No. 1004-0137

,
(forroerly 9-330) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR (See othet - ExpiresAugust 31, 1985

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT structionson

1
reverse side). 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NO.

UTU-68219

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEEOR TIUBE NAME

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG * UTE TRIBE

la. TYPEOFWELL OIL GAS
7. UNITAGREEMENTNAME

WELL WELL DRY O DEÚ N/A

bTYPEOFCOMPLETION ON-ÑØ'S
NEW WORK DEEP PLUG DIFF. 8. FARMORLEASENAME

WELL OVER EN BACK RESVR Other

2. NAME OF OPERATOR
9. WELL NO.

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
GH)f 13HG 17 8 21

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR.
Dahn.Caldwell@questar.com 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WlLDCAT

11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 435-781-4342 UNDESIGNATED

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements?

At surface SWSW - 675' FSL, 661' FWL S17-T8S-R21E 1L SEC.,T,, R., M., OR BLOCK AND SURVEY

/ fÑ$À OR AREA

At top rod. interval reported below SWNESW sW FSL,4500' FWL See 17, TBS R21E Mer SLB

At total depth NESW - 209F FSL,911002'FWL
14. PERMITNO.-API# DATEISSUED 12. COUNTYOR 13. STATE

43-047-34723 3/4/03 PARISH

Uintah UT

15. DATE SPUDDED 16 DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL (Readyto prod) 18. ELEVATÏONS (DI RKB, RT, GR, ETC.)* 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

4/09/03 6/22/03 7/3/03 8669' GL, 4691' KB

20. TOTAL DEPTH, MD & TVD 2L PLUGBACK T.D.,MD & TVD 22 IF MULTIPLECOMPL, 23. INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS

HOW MANY* DRILLED BY

7159' MD - 5312' TVD OPEN HOLE COMPLETION 1 ------> X

24. PRODUClNG INTERVAL(S), OF THIS COMPLETION-TOP, BOTIOM, NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTÏONAL
SURVEY MADE

5800'-7159' MD G-1Lime
YES

5321'-5312' TVD

26 EM
N DN R IT OLO EN TY LOG & GNL

27. WAS WELL CORED

28.
CASINGREC (Re rÏi Tiir siinwell)

CASING SlZE WEIGHT,LB./FT. DEPTH SET (MD) HOLE SIZE CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

9.625 36.0 470' MD 12-1/4" 175 sxs - Type 5

7.0 23# 5800' MD 8-3/4" 655 SXS HI-FILL & 50/50 POZ

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBINGRECORD

SIZE 10P (MD) BOTIOM (MD) SACKS ORMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET(MD) PACKER SET (MD)

NONE
2-7/8" 4796'

31. PERFORATION RECORD (Intervat size and number) 32. ACID, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE, ETC.

OPEN HOLE COMPLETION - 5800' - 7159' MD DEPTHINTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT ANDKIND OF MATERIAL USED

None None

33.*
PRODUCTION

DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTIONMETHOD (Mowing,gas hft, pumpingere andgpe ofpump) WELL STATUS (Producing or
shut-in)

7/03/03 Pumping -2-1/2" x 1-3/4" x 20 x 21 x 21-1/2" RHAC w/ 180" Stroke Producing

DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N FOR OK,-BBL GAS-MCF. WATER-BBL GAS-OIL RATIO

TEST PERIOD

7/12/03 24 > 240 0 238

FLOW. TUBING PRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL-BBL GAS-MCF WATER-BBL OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR.)

24-HOURRATE

170 24

33
DISPdO

TNAOFGAS (Sold usedfor fuel,venteg etc.)
TES ITNESSED BY

WEATHERFORI) SURVEY CALCULATION

36. I hereby certify that fo and att infonrption is c'mp and correct as determined from allavailableIecords

SIGNED Jim Si o ton (WIS is Down - manua Copv) TITLE Completion Su ervisor ÐATE 2/5/04

(See Instructions and Spaces for Additional Data on e e)L



37. SUMMARYOF POROUS ZONES: (Show all irnportantzones of porosityand contents thereof, cored intervals; and all

drill-stemtests, includingdepth intervaltested, cushion used, time tool opeu, flowingand shut-inpressures,and 38. G SOLOGICMARKERS

recoveries):

3HX 13HG 17 8 21

FORMATION TOP BOTTOM DESCRIPTION, CONTENTS, ETC.
TOP

G-1 Lime 5533' 5301'
NAME MEAS. DEPTH TRUE

VERT. DEPTH

Green River 2551'

00 Mahogany 3391'

I I LJ Kick Off 4825'
G-1 Lime 5533'

5785'
TD 10285'

OPEN HOLE COMPLETION 5800'-7159' MD

O



O O
United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
on Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
UT-922

July 12, 2004

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
Attn: Frank Nielsen
1050 17'" Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: 1 * Expansion, Final Approval
Gypsum Hills (Green River) Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

The 16 Expansion for the Gypsum Hills (Green River) Unit, Uintah County, Utah, was approved July
12, 2004. AIIof the requirements set forth in Section 2 have been fulfilled. Said expansion is
hereby approved to be effective June 1, 2004.

The basic information is as follows:

1. The expansion of the unit area was given preliminary approval by Bureau of Land
Management letter dated May 24, 2004.

2. As a result of the expansion, the unit area is increased from 1,320.00 acres to 2,637.99
acres, more or less, of which 2,637.99 acres (100 percent) are Federal lands.

3. Federal Leases UTU68219 and UTU68220 are included withinthe expanded unit area:

AIIlands and interests by State of Utah, Cause No. 253-01 are fullycommitted.

We are of the opinion that the expansion is necessary and advisable in the public interest for the
purpose of more properly conserving natural resources. Revised Exhibits "A"and "B"showing the
unit area as expanded and Exhibit "C" showing the new allocation schedule are acceptable.

Sincerely,

Is/ Terry Catlin

Terry Catlin
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure RECElVED
JUL15 2004

Dit OFOLGAS



- e e
bcc: Division of Oil, Gas and Mining

Trust Lands Administration
Sovereign Lands
Field Manager - Vernal w/enclosure
MMS - Data Management Division
File - Gypsum Hills (Green River) w/enclosure
Mary Higgins w/enclosure
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron.
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STATEOFUTAH FORM6
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

0 16
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

ENTITY ACTION FORM

Operator: QEP Uinta Basin Inc Operator Account Number: N 2460

Address: 11002 East 17500 South

citv Vernal

state UT zip 84078-8526 Phone Number: (435) 781-4300

Well 1

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

4304734928 WV EXT 2W-17-8-21 NWNE 17 8S 21E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

D 12436 14253 8/4/2003 8/10/2004
Comments·

Correction to unit and unit entity number. Not Wonsits Valley Unit nor Gypsum Hills (GR) Unit due to
formation (WSTC) not in unit. Operator to correct Form 10 & 11 from initial production. ER

CONFllENTIAL
Well 2

API Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

4304734723 Gypsum Hills 13HG-17-8-21 SWSW 17 8S 21E Uintah

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

D 13765 5355 8/10/2004

Comments
BLM approved expanded unit area to include all of Section 17 effective June 1, 2004

wellAPI
Number Well Name QQ Sec Twp Rng County

Action Code Current Entity New Entity Spud Date Entity Assignment
Number Number Effective Date

Comments: RECEiVED
Aub I U2004

AC M-CEs aEb
h new entity for new well (single wegV OlL,GAS&MININGEarlene Russell For DOGM

B - Add new well to existing entity (groupor unit well) Name (Ple se Print)

C - Re-assign well from one existing entity to another existing entity ¿T

D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity Signatu

E - Other (Explain in 'comments' section) Engineering Tech 8/10/2004
Title Date



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

2F
Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-QuestarE&P Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900

CA No. Unit: GYPSUM HILLS UNIT
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED LISTS *

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/31/2005

4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143

Sa. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 4/23/2007 BIA

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 4/23/2007

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033

3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.
SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xis 4/30/2007 AND



1 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
GYPSUM HILLSUNIT

Original Well Name Q/Q l SEC | TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

GDCPSIINIHIIJLS3 GII3 NENH 20 I 080S 210E 4304720002 5355 Federal TVI A
(ifPSLDAHDLLS4 GII4 STVSE 19 !080S 210E 4304730028 5355 Federal ONV P
G3CPSlÏ¾IHILLS6 GH6 NEbPN i 20 080S 210E 4304730099 5251 Federal VVI A
CX3STikSFED1-.20-z‡B GH 1-20 FRESVV 20 080S 210E 4304731006 5355 Federal TVI A
WHITON FED 1-19-3C GH 1-19 SESE 19 080S ':210E 4304731065 5355 Federal OW P
COSTAS FED 2-20-3B GH 2-20 NESE 20 080S | 210E 4304731066 5355 Federal WI A
STAGECOACH FED 23-21 GH 23-21 NWSW 21 080S | 210E 4304731541 5355 Federal OW P
COSTAS FED 3-21-lD GH 3-21 SWNW 21 080S 210E 4304731604 i 5355 Federal WI A
COSTAS FED 4-21-IC GH 4-21 SENW 21 080S 210E 4304731826 5355 Federal OW P
CX3STikSFED5-21-2C GH5-21 SETTE 21 080S 210E 4304731827 5355 Federal CTW7 P
SPJJ8-I GBJ8-I SYVfDB 20 080S 210E 4304731932 5355 Federal YVI A
GYPSUM HILLS 9 GH 9 SENE 20 080S 210E 4304732304 5355 Federal OW P
GPfPSIlhdllILI?; 10 GHI 10 NVISE 21 080S 210E 4304732306 5355 Federal NVI A
CTYPSUlvlHILLS 12 GH12 knESE L9 080S 210E 4304732458 5355 Federal TVI A
(3Ÿl SLnviFDIALS11 Gill 11 PINVSE 20 080S 210E 4304732459 5355 Fedend ()?V P
GPfPSilhdEIL1-S 13 Gill 13 >U¯STV 21 080S 210E 4304732460 5355 Federal ()NV P
GYPSUM HILLS 14 GH 13 NWSW 20 080S 210E 4304732647 5355 Federal OW P
GiYPS.UhfHIIALS15 GH 15 SVVSTV 20 080S 210E 4304732648 5355 Fedend TVI A
GifPSLTW1HIIJUS17 GH 17 STVSE 20 080S 210E 4304732649 5355 Fedend SNT 4
GYPSUM HILLS 18 GH 18 SESE 20 080S 210E 4304732650 5355 Federal OW P
CifPSUM1HILLS 19 GH19 SV FB¥ 20 080S 210E 4304732651 5355 Federal ¡ONV P
GYPSUM HILLS 20 GH 20 SENW 20 080S 210E 430473_2652 5355 Federal OW P
GYPSUM HILLS 16 GH 16 SESW 20 080S 210E 4304732675 5355 Federal OW P
GHU 10W-19-8-21 GH 10W-19-8-21 NWSE I 19 080S 210E 4304733528 12736 Federal GW P
GII 1013-19-8-21 Gli 10N3-19-8-.21 fivVSE 19 080S 210E 4304733566 5355 Federal ()97 P
WVFU 11W-17-8-21 WV 11W-17-8-20 NESW 17 080S 210E 4304733912 13228 Federal GW P
WV SW-17-8-21 |WV 5W-17-8-21 SWNW 17 080S 210E 4304733954 13332 Federal GW P
WV 7W-17-8-21 WV 7W-17-8-21 SWNE 17 080S 210E 4304733956 13330 Federal GW P
GII99V-17-8-21 3El95V-17-8-21 FRESE 17 080S 210E 4304734150 13392 Federd 39V P
GH 16W-17-8-21 GH 16W-17-8-21 SESE 17 - 080S 210E 4304734156 13354 Federal GW -P
WV EXT 10W-17-8-21 WVX 10W-17-8-20 NWSE 17 080S 210E 4304734561 13744 Federal GW P
GH EXT 15W-17-8-21 GHX 15W-17-8-20 SWSE 17 . 080S 210E 4304734562 13674 Federal GW P
GYPSUM HILLS 13ÌIG-17-8-21 GHX 13HG-17-8-21 SWSW 17 · 080S 210E 4304734723 5355 Federal OW S
ÕH lG-17-8-21 GH lG-17-8-21 NENE 17 i 080S 210E 4304734927 5355 Federal OW P
WV EXT 2W-17-8-21 WVX 2W-17-8-20 NWNE 17 080S 210E 4304734928 14253 Federal |GW P
WV EXT 8W-17-8-21 WVX 8W-17-8-20 SENE 17 080S 210E 4304734929 13792 |Federal GW P
GH 4MU-20-8-21 GH 4MU-20-8-21 NWNW 20 080S 210E 4304735068 14213 Federal GW P
GYPSUM HILLS 13MU-20-8-21 GH 13MU-20-8-20 SWSW i 20 080S 210E 4304735070 14817 Federal GW P
GH 5W-20-8-21 GH SW-20-8-21 SWNW

· 20 080S 210E 4304735097 14557 Federal GW P
WVX 3MU-17-8-21 WVX 3MU-17-8-21 NENW 17 080S 210E 4304735318 14113 Federal GW P
GH 15ML-18-8-21 GH 15ML-18-8-21 SWSE I 18 080S 210E 4304735323 15483 Federal GW



2 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTARE and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
GYPSUM HILLSUNIT

OriginalWellName Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease WellType Status

GH 1ML-19-8-21 GH IML-19-8-21 NENE 19 080S 210E i 4304735324 14824 ·Federal GW P
GH 16W-19-8-21 GH 16W-19-8-21 SESE 19 080S 210E , 4304735325_ 14823 IFederal GW DRL
WVX 14MU 17-8-21 WVX 14MU 17-8-21 SESW 17 080S 210E 4304735369 14098 :Federal GW P
WVX 12MU-17-8-21 WVX 12MU-17-8-21 NWSW 17 080S 210E 4304735370 15108 ,Federal GW P
WVX 8MU-19-8-21 WVX 8MU-19-8-21 _ ______

SENE 19 080S 210E . 4304735372 14241 |Federal GW P
GH 10ML-18-8-21 GH 10ML-18-8-21 NWSE 18 080S 210E : 4304735391 15482 IFederal GW P
GE 8G-17-8-21 GH 8G-17-8-21 SENE _ 17 080S 210E 4304737992 5355 Federal OW DRL
GH 16G-17-8-21 GH 16G-17-8-21 SESE 17 080S 210E 4304737993 5355 :Federal OW iDRL
WVX 1MU-17-8-21 WVX IMU-17-8-21 NENE 17 080S 210E ' 4304738156 |Federal GW APD
GH 8MU-20-8-21 GH 8-20-8-21 SENE 20 080S 210E 4304738157 |Federal GW APD
WVX 13MU-17-8-21 WVX 13MU-17-8-21 SWSW 17 080S | 210E 4304738188 Federal GW APD
WVX 6MU-l7-8-21 WVX 6MU-17-8-21 SENW 17 080S

,
2l0E 4304738189 Federal GW APD

WVX 4MU-17-8-21 WVX 4MU-17-8-21 NWNW 17 080S : 210E 4304738190 Federal GW APD
WVi 16MU-18-8-21 WVX 16MU-Ï8ÀÃl SESE 18 080S 210E 4304738191 '

Federal GW APD
GH 2MU-19-8-21 GH 2MU-19-8-21 NWNE 19 080S i 210E 4304738192 Federal GW APD
GH 3MU-19-8-21 GH 3MU-19-8-21 NENW 19 080S | 210E 430Ã738250 Federal GW APD
GH 4MU-19-8-21 GH 4MU-19-8-21 NWNW 19 080S 210E 4304738264 Federal GW APD
GH 5MU-19-8-21 GH 5MU-19-8-21 SWNW 19 080S 210E 4304738265 Federal GW APD
GH 6MU-19-8-21 GH 6MU-19-8-21 SENW 19 080S 210E 430Ã738266| Federal .GW APD
GH7MU-19-8-21 IGH7D-19-8-21 SWNE ! 19 080S 210E 4304738267 | Federal GW APD
GH llMU-19-8-21 IGH 11MU-19-8-21 NESW : 19 080S 210E 4304738268 Federal GW APD
GH 12MU-19-8-21 IGH 12MU-19-8-21 NWSW I 19 080S 210E 4304738269 Federal GW APD
GH 15MU-19-8-21 ,GH 15MU-19-8-21 SWSE 19 080S 210E 4304738270 IFederal GW APD
GH 14MU-19-8-21 GH 14MU-19-8-21 SESW 19 080S 210E 4304738472 Federal GW APD
WVX lMU-18-8-21 IWVX 1MU-18-8-21 NENE | 18 080S 210E 4304738659 iFederal GW APD
WVX 9MU-18-8-21 WVX 9MU-18-8-21 NESE ; 18 080S 210E 4304738660 Federal GW APD
WVX 8MU-18-8-21 GH 8G-18-8-21 SENE 18 080S 210Ë 4304738661 Federal !GW APD
GH 6MU-20-8-21 GH 6-20-8-21 SENW 20 080S 210E 4304738662 ŸederalIGW



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN AcLhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells, significantlydeepen existingwella below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drillhorizontal laterale. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT 70 DRILLform forsuch proposals See attached

1. TYPE OF WELL 6. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER see attached
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR 9.APINUMBER.
QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver s, CO ,80265 (303) 308-3068

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

a CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUSPLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHEn: Operator Name
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED ORCOMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshowallpertinentdetails Including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record,QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., willhereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. This name change involves only an Internal corporate name change and no thirdparty
change ofoperator is involved. The same employeeswillcontinueto be responsible for operations ofthe properties described
on theattached list. AIIoperationswillcontinueto be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965003033
Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operator of record, QEP UINTABASIN,INC , hereby r signs as operatorof the properties as described on the
attached list.

Ja es , Executive Vice President, QEP UInta Basin, Inc.
Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIO blD PO UCTIONCOMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligationsas operator of the propertles as descr ed on the ttachedlist

Jayf. Neese, Exec tiveVice President
Questar Exploration and Production Company

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) D a K. ,Stanberry ; ) TITLE Supervlsor,Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE '
DATE 3/16/2007

(This space for Stato use only)

RECE"!E
APRI S 2007

(5/2000) (See instructions on Reverse Side)



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:
see attached

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS see attached
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:Do not use thisform for proposals to drillneW wells, significantly deepen existingwells beloW Current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, orto see attacheddrill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals,

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver _ CO 80265 (303) 308-3068

4 LOCATioN OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE attached coUNTY; UIntah

QTR/QTR, BECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION[¯]

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATECURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFFDate ofworkcompletion:
COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS REGLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Name Changes
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show allpertinentdetalls Including dates, depths, volumes,etc.

PER THE ATTACHEDLIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTS THATTHE
INDIVIDUALWELL NAMES BE UPDATED IN YOUR RECORDS.

NAME(PLEASE PRINT) /) , TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE 4/17/2007

(This apaoo for Stato use only)

RECEIVED
APR13 2007(See instructions on Reverse Side)

DIV.OFOlL,GAS&MINING
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't United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Roe a Utah State Office TAKE Pmon'
P.O. Box 45155 NgM ERICA

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

April23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Gypsum Hills (GR) Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as UnitOperator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor UnitOperator for the Gypsum Hills (GR) Unit,Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unitagreement. The instrument is hereby approved effectiveApril23, 2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the

designated party has obtained all required approval that wouldentitle it to conduct operations under
the Gypsum Hills (GR) Unit Agreement.

Your nationwideoiland gas bond No. ESBOOOO24willbe used to cover allfederal operations within
the Gypsum Hills (GR) Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approvedinstruments are being distributedto the appropriatefederaloffices,with one copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil,Gas &Mining
File - Gypsum Hills(GR)Unit(wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron 20
Reading File
Central Files APR30 2001

UT922:TAThompson:tt:4/23/07



Fonn 316 5 UNITED STATES (°y
37(August ) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Špires: July 31, 2010

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease SeriëlNo,
UTU-68219

SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an

aþandoned well, Use Form 3180-3 (APD) for suchpf9fið$8Ñ. UTE TRIBE

$UBilflT IN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions onpage 2. 7. If Unit of CA/Agreement,Nameand/or No,
GYPSUM HILLSUNIT

I. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas Well O Other 8. Well Name andG 13HG-17-8-21
2. Name of Overator 9. APIWellNo.
QUESTAR EXPLORATION&PRODUCTION CO. CONTACT: JAN NELSON 43-047-34723

$a.Àddress 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10.Field and Pool or Exploratory Area
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH, VERNAL, UTAN 84078

435) 781-4331
4. Locationof Well (Footage, Sec., T.,R.,M,or BurveyDescription) 11.Countryor Parnh, State

675' FSL 661' FWL. SWSW. SECTION 17. TSS, R21E UINTAH,UTAH

11 CHECKTHE APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

Notice of Intent Q Acidize Deepen Production (Start/Resume) O Water S ut-Off

O^uercasins vracturetreat a.ciamation O weliineerity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplete Other
_

E te

Change Plans Plug and Abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandomnent Notice Convert to Injection Plug Back Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or CompletedOperation:Clearlystate all pertinentdetails, includingestimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof. If
the proposal is to deependirectionally or recomplete horizontally,give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinentmarkers and zones.
Attachthe Bond under which the work will be performed or providethe BondNo. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports mustbe filedwithin 30 days
followingcompletion of the involvedoperations. If the operation results in a multiple completionor recompletion in a new interval, a Form3160-4mustbe filedonce
testinghas been completed. Final Abandonment Notices must be filedonly after all requirements, incindingreclamation, have been completed and the operator has
determinedthatthe site is ready for final inspection.)

Questar Exploration & Production co proposes to re-enter the GH 13HG-17-8-21 and drillan additional lateral. Please referto the attached:
1. Re-Entry Procedure
2. Directional DrillingPlan
3. 8-point DrillingProgram 6 OO

¾:2"J's!."A'.."°PrreepŒae a
UELS

6. Location Layout refering toReserve Pit

BHL Lease is UTU-68220 NOV2 4 m
BHLTD is 7,963'MD
Bottom hole footages are 2000' FNL 1000' FEL, SWSW, Section 19. TSS, R21E

DIV OF OIL,GAS & MINING

Should you need further technicalinformation, Please contactour DrillingEngineer, Marna Sikes at (303) 308-3079.

14. Thereby certify thatthe Ibr ingis trueand correct Name (Printed/Typed)

Laur Bi Tide Associate SRegulatoryAffairsAnalyst

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERALAR WATE OFFICE USE

Approvedb

RR LFYG, HILL
Conditions of approval, if a a d AþpiovalofÏhÏsnoticodoesnot warrant or MENTALMANAGER *

that the applicant holds legal or eq e to thoserights in the subject lease which w Ice

entitle theagpliedtit to conduct ó¢erätio iëii

Title 18IIS.C. Section1001 and 'titlel3UXO Section 1112, rnake it a crime for any person knowingly and wilÏfullyto make to any department or agency of the United States any false,
fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter wíthin its jurisdiction.

Tiristructionson page ž)
fillderalApproval of tidi
Actionis



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAREXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Re-Entry

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil & Gas No. 1, and
the approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of its
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to
insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated top of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth,TVD Depth,MD
Green River 2,124' 2,124'
Kick Off Point 4,543' 4,547'
GreenRiver (Gl Lime) 5,312' 5,711'
TD 5,294' 7,963'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil, Gas, Water, and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top an bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas,
or other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered as follows:

Substance Formation Depth, TVD Depth, MD
Oil/Gas Green River (Gl Lime) 5,711' 5,763' - 7,963'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling
will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be
tested to determine comrnercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are
detected, samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses
conducted. Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits Valleywater right A36125
(which was filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was
filed on March 25, 1960). It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that
any water right number filed before 1989 is not depletingto the Upper Colorado
River System, to supply fresh water for drilling purposes. All water resulting
from drilling operations will be disposed of at Red Wash Central Battery Disposal
site; SWSE, Section 27, T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site; SWNW,
Section 12, TSS, R21E.

Page 1 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION& PRODUCTION COMPANY
GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Re-Entry

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment

A. 3,000 psi double gate, 3,000 psi annular (schematic attached)

B. Function test daily.

C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.22psi/ft or 1,500 psi,
whichever is greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test
pressure shall not exceed the internal yield of the casing.

D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to rated
working pressure if isolated by a test plug or to 50% of the internal yield
pressure of casing, whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall
meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2 for
equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 3M system
and individual components shall be operable as designed.

4. Casing Program

As this well is a re-entry of an existing well the surface and production casing
strings are already in place as detailed below.

Hole Size CasingSize Depth, MD Weight Grade
12 3/4" 9 5/8" 470' 36 J-55
8 3/4" 7" 5,800' 23 L-80/M-80

The lateral portion of this wellbore will be cased with a slotted liner.

IIole Size Casing Size Top, MD Bottom, MD Weight Grade
6 1/8" 4 1/2" flush 4,557' 7,963' 11.6 P-110

Please refer to the attached wellbore diagram and re-entry procedure for further
details.

5. Cementing Program

As this is a re-entry well and the newly drilled lateral will be cased off with a
slotted liner dropped in the open hole there will be no cement required to drill this
well. Please refer to the attached wellbore diagram for existing casing and cement
conditions.

6. Auxilliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - Yes
B. Float at the bit - No

Page 2 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Re-Entry

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually and/or PVT or Flow
Show

D. Fully opening safety valve on the rig floor - Yes

Rotating Head - Yes

Drilling the surface hole with air:

A variance from 43 CFR 3l60 Onshore Oil and Gas Order #2, Section III
requirements, subsection E Special Drilling Operations is requested for the
specific operation of drilling and setting surface casing on the subject well with a
truck mounted air rig. The variance from the following requirements of Order #2
is requested because surface casing depth for this well is less than 500 feet and
high pressures are not expected.

a. Properly lubricated and maintained rotating head. A diverter system
in place of a rotating head. The diverter system forces the air and cutting
returns to the reserve pit and is used to drill the surface casing.

b. Blooie line discharge 100' from well bore and securely anchored. The
blooie line discharge for this operation will be located 50 to 70 feet from
the wellhead. This reduced length is necessary due to the smaller location
size to minimize surface disturbance.

c. Automatic ignitor or continuous pilot light on the blooie line. A
diffuser will be used rather than an automatic pilot/ignitor. Water is
injected into the compressed air and eliminates the need for the pilot light
and the need for dust suppression equipment.

d. Compressors located in the opposite direction from the blooie line a
minimum of 100 feet from the well bore. Compressors located 50 feet
on the opposite side of the well bore from the blooie line and is equipped
with a 1) emergency kill switch on the driller's console, 2) pressure relief
valve on the compressor, 3) spark arrestors on the motors.

e. Deflector on the end of the blooie line - Questarwill mount a deflector
unit at the end of the blooie line for the purpose of changing the direction
and velocity of the air and cuttings flow into the reserve pit. Changing the
velocity and direction of the cuttings and air will preserve the pit liner. In
the event the deflector washes out due to erosion caused by the sand
blasting effect of the cuttings, there will be no problem because the
deflector is rnounted on the very end of the blooie. A washed out deflector
will be easily replaced.

Page 3 of



ONSHORE OIL & GA$ ORDERNO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION COMPANY
GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Re-Entry

g. Flare Pit - there will be no need of a flare pit during the surface hole air
drilling operation because the blooie line is routed directly to the reserve
pit. When the big rig arrives for the main drilling after setting surface
casing, all flare lines will be routed to the flare pit.

Drilling of the lateral will be done with fresh water KCl based mud systems
consisting primarily of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash,
polymers, and KCl. No chromates will be used. It is not intended to use oil in the
mud, however, in the event it is used the concentration will be less than 4% by
volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 9.8 ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow show will be used upon exit of existing production casing to TD.

Gas detectorwill be used upon exit of existing production casing to TD.

1. Testing, Logging, and Coring Program

A. Cores - None Anticipated

B. DST - None Anticipated

C. Logging:
i. Mud logging from casing exit to TD

ii. MWD-GR will be utilized during drilling operations to aid in
landing the curve and maintaining the lateral within the desired
zone.

D. Formation and completion interval: G1 Lime interval, final determination
of completion will be made by analysis of mud logging data. Stimulation:
stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest encountered.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been
encountered or is known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in
the general area. Maximum anticipated bottom-hole pressure equals
approximately 3,400 psi. Maximum anticipated bottom hole temperature is
approximately 150°F.

Page 4 of



ONSHORE OIL s JAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAREXPLORATION& PRODUCTIONCOMPANY
GH 13HG-17-8-21 RE-ENTRY

I " RotatingHead
Flowline

7 11/ 3M Spacer Spool

7 1/16" 3M Annularor 11"

2" KillLine 3 ChokeUne

2" 3M2" 3M 2' 3M 3 3M F 3M
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11" 3M Casing Head
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QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION

GHX 13HG-17-8-21
API: 43-047-34723
Summarized Re-Entry Procedure

1. Rig down pumping unit, clear location of all unnecessary equipment.
2. MIRU pulling unit.
3. ND tubing head, NU BOP's (3M).
4. Kill well if necessary.
5. Pull out of hole with 209 rods (1 - 1/2" x 26' polish, 1 - 7/8" x 2' pony, 3 - 7/8"

x 6' pony, 96 - 7/8" slick, 98 - 3/4" slick, & 10 - ¾" guided) and 2 ½" xl 3/4" x
16' x 19 x 21' RHAC pump.

6. Unseat tubing anchor and POOH with 164jts 2 '/g"6.5# J-55 tubing,TAC, PSN,
and 2 pup joints.

7. PU bit and 7" casing scraper, RIH to 4,650'.
8. Roll hole with hot oiler, TOOH with bit and scraper.
9. RU wireline truck and RIH with CIBP.
10. Set t p.of CIBP @+/- 4,557', 5' above nearest collar ~ 4,553', POH.
11. ND BOP's
12. RD pulling unit, move off location.
13. MIRU drilling rig.
14. NU rig's 3,000 WP rated BOP.
15. RIH with whipstock, orient and set whipstock on top of CIBP set at ~4,557'

oriented at 212° ± azimuth. If it is off a little, it is better to be less (<212 °) rather
than greater (>215°) due to the tendencyfor the bit to turn right as it comes out of

the window. Plus or minus 2-3°is acceptable.

16. Shear setting pins and start milling operations, mill window in 7" casing @4,538'
top, 4,547' bottom and pilot hole. Work mills in and out of window several
times,

17. TOOH, PU directional BHA and gyro tool, TIH.
18. Gyro steer the well at a 212° azimuth with 7.44°/100' build rates to 45 to 60 feet

or until the MWD tools have cleared the casing and are providing accurate

readings.
19. Pull gryo tool and continue to drill with directional equipment to land in the Gl

Lime formation at a TVD of +/- 5,312' TVD, +/- 5,711'



20. Drill +/- 2,200' of lateral in the Gl Lime with a 1.25° apparent down dip angle.
a. Mud system to be a weighted water based mud, weights are expected to be in

the 8.8 -9.8 ppg range.
21. Circulate and condition hole, TOOH, LD 3,400' of drill pipe.

a. PU 2,200' of 4 1/2" flush slotted liner, 1206' of blank liner and liner dropping
tool.
b. RIH w/ liner and dropping tool, drop liner at 4,557', just outside window.
c. TOOH laying down remainder of the drill pipe.

22. RIH and set RBP @+/- 4,000' to isolate lateral.
23. ND BOP's.
24.



GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Updated11-18-08MS

API#43-047-34723

ProposedWBD

UlntaBasin

Sec 17-T8S-R21E,UINTAHCO,UT SW36#J-55@470'
2 3/4"HoleSize

KB4,683.5'
GL4,668'

NOTE: NOT TO SCALE

Whipstockwindowfrom4,538'- 4,547
Knight? 3 degree

RTSP4.557

4 1/2"11.6#P-110LTC EnterG15,711'MD ./ 7 23#L-80/M-60

7,963'MD5,294'TVD 5,31f TVD ..
•, 5,800'MD5,316TVD 7,159'MD5,325TVD

4 1/2" blank &slotted liner, W lateral .,- ..
OriginalLateral

Perforated4 1/2"11,6#P-110LTC5,763'-7,983'
Blank4 1/2"11.6#P-110LTC



GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Re-Entry Plan 11-17-08 Proposal
ReportDale: November 18,2008 SunreyI DLSComputationMethod: MinlmumCurvature/ Lubinski

Cilent: VerticalSecdonAdmuth: 212.070°
Fleid: UInta Vertica18ectionOrigin: N 0.000ft, E 0.000ft

structure)Slot: GypsumHills/ GHX13HG-17-8-21 IVDReference Datum: KB
Well: GHX13HG-17-8-21 TVDReference Elevation: 4683.5ft mlativetoMSL

Borehele: Re-Entry Sea Bed /Ground LevelElevation: 4718.000ftrelativetoMSL
UWIfAPI#: MagneticDeclination: 11.445°

Survey Namel Date: GHX13HG-17-9-21Re-EntryPlan 1î-17-08/ November17 2008 Total FieldStrength: 52666,845nT
fort I AHDI DDII ERDratfo: 113.256°/ 3140.00ft I 5.727/ 0.591 MagneticDip: 66.022'

GrldCoordinate System: NADS3UtahStatePlanes,CentralZone,USFeet DeclinationDate: November17,2008
LocationLatlLong: N407 3.590,W109357.920 MagneticDecilnationModel: IGRF2005

LocationGridNIEYlX: N7217313.014ftUS,E2175769.108ftUS NorthReference: TrueNorth
GridConvergenceAngle +1.22636637° TotalCorr MagNorth->True North: +11,445°

GridScale Factor: 0.99991096 LocalCoordinates ReferencedTo: WellHead

Commuts MeDaesed Inclination Azimuth TVD NS EW Closure DLS ToolFace Northing Easting

(It) (deg) . (deg) (It) (it) lit) (It) (ft) (deg) (degl100ft) (deg) (it08) (ftBS)
Projected-Up 0.00 0 00 0 00 0 00 0.00 0 00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0 00M 7217313.01 2175769.11

17.50 0.00 0.00 17.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00M 7217313.01 2175769.11
41 40 0 00 0.00 41 40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00M 7217313.01 2175769.11
46.80 0.00 0.00 46.80 0.00 0.00 0 00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00M 7217313.01 2175769.11
77.10 0 00 0.00 77.10 0.00 0.00 0 00 0.00 0.00 0.00 160.40M 7217313.01 2175769,11

518.00 0 40 160.40 518.00 0.95 -1.45 0 52 1.54 160.40 0.09 77.10M 7217311.58 2175769.66
640.00 0.60 77.10 839.99 0.77 -1 71 1.28 2.14 143,12 0.56 73 50M 7217311.33 2175770.43
763.00 1.40 73.50 762.97 -0.81 -1.14 3,35 3.54 108.76 0.65 31,10M 7217311.95 2175772.48

2140.00 2.10 31.10 2139.38 -38..65 25 24 32,51 41.16 52.17 0.10 32.80M 7217338 95 2175801.07
2342.00 1.80 32.80 2341.26 -45.53 31.08 36.14 47,67 49.31 0.15 -52.00M 7217344 86 2175804.57

2774,00 1.50 308.00 2773,13 -52.90 40.26 35.36 53.59 41.29 0.52 -62,30M 7217354.02 2175803.60
2869.00 1.70 297.70 2868.10 -52.92 41.69 33,13 53.25 38,48 0.37 -37..50M 7217355.40 2175801.34
2965.00 2,40 322.50 2964 D4 -53.51 43.94 30.65 53.58 34.90 1.16 -45,50M 7217367.60 2175798.81
3154.00 2.60 314,50 3152.86 -55.81 50.09 25.18 56.06 26.69 0.21 -24.50M 7217363.62 2175793.21
3281.00 1.Ì0 335.50 3279.77 -57.47 53.82 22.35 58.28 22.55 0.93 11.60M 7217367.29 2175Ž90,30

3408,00 2.60 11.60 3406.68 -61.21 58.36 22.15 62.42 20.78 1.25 33.00M 7217371.83 2175790.00
3597,00 3,50 33.00 3595.42 -70.99 67,39 26 15 72 29 21.21 0.76 30.50M 7217380.95 2175793.81
3660.00 3.20 30.50 3658.31 -74.67 70.52 28,09 76.91 21.72 0.53 36.60M 7217384.11 2175795.68
3787.00 3.50 36.60 3785,09 -82.08 76.69 32.20 83.17 22.78 0.37 37.60M 7217390.37 2175799.66
3851.00 4,00 37,60 3848.96 -86 25 80,03 34.73 87.24 23.46 0.79 38.50M 7217393.76 2175802.11

3913.00 4.40 38.50 3910.79 -90.77 83.60 37.53 91.64 24.17 0.65 39.90M 7217397.39 2176804.83
3976.00 4.10 39.90 3973.62 -95.40 87,22 40.48 96-15 24.89 0.50 51.50M 7217401.07 2175807.70
4104.00 4.40 51.50 4101.27 -104.56 93.79 47,25 105.02 26.74 0.71 5300M 7217407,78 2175814.34
4167.00 4 40 53.00 4164.08 -109.10 96.74 51.08 109.40 27.83 0.18 48.20M 7217410.82 2175818,10
4231.00 4,50 48.20 4227.89 -113.81 99.90 54.91 113.99 28.80 0.60 41.80M 7217414.05 2175821.86

4294,00 4.60 41.80 4290.69 -118,67 103.43 58.43 118.79 29.47 0.82 35 70M 7217417.66 2175825.31
4357,00 5.10 35.70 4353.47 -123,96 107.58 61.75 124.05 29.86 1.14 -6.68G 7217421.88 2175828,54
4420,00 5.60 35.10 4416.19 -129.82 112.37 65.15 129,89 30.11 0.80 159,09G 7217426.74 2175831.84

Tie-In to Oridinal Hole 4483.00 4 80 38.80 4478.93 -135.51 116.94 68.57 135.56 30,39 1.38 -148.00M 7217431,39 2175835,16
4531.00 0.00 212.00 4526.88 -137.50 118 51 69.83 137.55 30.51 10.00 -148.00M 7217432.90 2175836.38

KOP-Build7,44/100ft 4547.00 0.00 212.00 4542.88 -137,50 118.61 69,83 137.55 30.51 0.00 -148.00M 7217432.98 2175836.38
G1 Lirne Top 5711.00 86.60 212.00 5311.67 586.92 -495.84 -314.06 586.93 212.35 7.44 0.00G 7216810 61 2175465.76

Hold 5763.48 90.50 212.00 5313.00 639.37 -540,32 -341.85 639,38 212.32 T.44 0.00G 7216765.55 2175438.93
PBHL/TD 7963.48 90.50 212.00 5293.80 2839.29 -2405.95 -1507,63 2839.29 212.07 0.00 0 OOG 7214875.57 2174313.45

Survev Tvue: Non-Def Proposal

Survey Error Model: SLB ISCWSA version 22 "* 3-D 95.00% Confidence 2.7955 sigma
Surveying Proq:

MD From I ft ) MD To (ft) EÒU Freq Survey Tool Type Borehole -> Survey
-34.50 0.00 Act-Stas SLB MWD-STD Original Hole -> GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Field Survey

0 00 4483.00 Act-Stns SLB_MWD-STD Original Hole -> GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Field Survey
4483 00 7963.48 1/100.00 SLB_MWD-STD Re-Entry -> GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Re-Entry Plan 11-17-08

WellDesign Ver Bid( doc40x__37)GHX13HG-17-8-21\GHX13HG-17-8-21\Re-Entry\GHX13HG-17-8-21 Re-Entry Pla:GL×hd MM 11/19/2008 10:18 AM Page 1 of
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uagem st14eP FR StimonT tan W1053E7SED Smitis; 2Disept1tUB ScahnlitestialaliiF Flum WEII 421aErleral.smisektalT,son
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i _ . __ . «< W Scale = 1(in):1200(ft) E »>

True Nonh -1200 0 1200
Tot Corr (M->T
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GilM f3NG.17.8.21 GHX1|ING-17·8·21G1 UmeTop GWWtaHG-17-B-21Re-Entry Plan 11-17-05
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6000

-1200 0 1200 2400
VerticalSection (ft)Azim= 212.07·, Scale = 1(in):1200(ft) Origin .0 N/-S, O El-W
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Lege nd

KOP-Build 4547.00 0.00 212.00 4542 88 -137.50 118.51 69.83 0 00 Date Drawn:Tut:DJ:05
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Hold 5763.48 90.50 212.00 5313 00 639.37 -540.32 -341.85 7.44 Checked by

PBHI/ID 7963.48 90.50 212.00 5293 80 2839 29 -2405 95 -1507 63



TBS, R21E, S.L.B.&M QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
Well location, GH #13HG-17-8-21
(SURFACE LOCATION),located os shown in
the SW 1/4 SW 1/4 of Section 17, T8S,

SS8'14'W - 39.64 (G.L.O.)
88°09'W

- 39.58 (G.L.o.) R21E, S.L.B.&M. Uintoh County, Utah.

BASIS OF ELEVATION
SENCH MARK 20EAM LOCATEDIN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION 35,
TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE, QUADRANGLE,
UTAH, UINTAHCOUNTY, 7.5 MINUTEQUAD. (TOPOGRAPHICMAP)
PUBLISHED BY THE UNITEDSTATES DEPARTMENTOF THE
INTERIOR,GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKEDAS
BEING 4697 FEET.

BASlS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

1967
Br as Ûœp 1967

¯o To
o o o

THE PROPOSED LATERAL2 BOTTOMHOLE FOR
THIS WELL IS LOCATEDIN THE SE 1/4 NE 1/4
OF SECTION19, TSS, R2tE. S.LB.&M. AT A
DISTANCEOF 2000' FNL 1000' FEL lT BEARS
$30'47'34"W 3123.42' FROM THE PROPOSED SC A LE
WELLHEAD.

CERTIFICATE A
----- THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHAT TMEABOVE PR

FIELDNOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYSM UN
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME A AND C REic9
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BEUE * NO. 1

661' Hex Ungraded Ground = 4668'
REGIS DL OR

REVISED: 11-20-08 L.K.
7gs; REVfSED: û9-19-02 D.COX sTATE 7E OF
Brass Cop gggigt

Ries Unrra ENGINEERING & IAND DURVZYING
SB9 32'49"W - 2644.92' (Meas.) S60'03'f f"W - 2641 Ï0' (ReaÄf 19 77

er ys co? 85 SOUTH ßOO EAST - VERMAI. UTAN 84078
(435) 789-1017

LEGEND: LATITUDE = 4 'O '03 9" (40.117664) scALE1"
= 0 1 7 02

= 90 SYMBOL LONGITUDE= 10 5 0 92" (109.585533)
PARTY EFEREÑOES

= PROPOSED WELLHEAD. LATITUDE= 4097'03.72" (40.117700)
D.A. J.A. D.COX G.L.O. PLAT

A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE=
109°35'05.43" (†09.584842)

Q ESTAR EXPLR. &



TBS, R21E, S. L. B. &M. QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
Well location, LATERAL2 GH #13HG-17-8-21

"",,,"gi,,g,

'Kiirfi;Ê.7 (BOTTOMHOLE), located as shown in the SW 1/4
og

SteelPostO.7NLY Og,SeatteredSimes SW1/4 of Section 17, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah
Poe of stones 589°50'26"W SB9°51'12"W County, Utah.
/ sas42'40"W - 2617.40' fugas. 7J19.9J' fMeas.) 1J19.56' (Mem) BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK20EAM LOCATEDIN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION35,
TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKENFROM THE OURAYSE, QUADRANGLE,
UTAH, UINTAHCOUNTY, 7.5 MINUTEQUAD. (TOPOGRAPHICMAP)
PUBLISHEDBY THE UNITEDSTATES DEPARTMENTOF THE

LOT 1 INTERIOR,GEOLOGlCAL SURVEY. SAID ELEVATIONIS MARKEDAS
BEING4697 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS
BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.

LOT 2
LA7ERAL 2 00' ' N

«seo r sm., c., BOTTOMHOLE A
on Go/v. Pþe 1.4'
H/ph Set Stone en
East Side of Cap

1967 Omse ¢op
1.0' H/ph, Pante
Copperwe/4 Two
Large Stones

THE PROPOSEDBOTTOMHOLEFOR THIS WELL
ARS O 34"W 3D.23.42' FROMTHE

SCALE
LOT3

CERTIFICATE lii
..------ THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHATTHE ABOVE

FI6LDNOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS MA UN
SUPERVISIONAND THATTHE SAMEA AND CORREC
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BEUE * No. 161319

o -

LOT 4 REGI O OR
REGISTR . 131

1967 Ðross Cop 1967 Brass ¢çp 1967 Bmse Cap
1D1 0-0 L.K.COX sTATE 7

.4 '21"W - 2638.84 e SB9°22'¢1"W
- 2665.4 UnrfAH NGD1EER1NG & IAND G

85 30UTH 200 EAST - VERNAZ. UTAH 840'78
LATERAL2 BOTTOMHOLE (4ss) 789-1017

LEGEND: LANTUDE = 4 0 '3n7" (40.110297) 1" - 1000'
DATEsu11

7 02
= 90 SYMBOL LONGITUDE=

109°35'28.46" (109.591239) PARTY REFERENots
(NAD 27) D.A. J.A. D.COX G.LO. PLAT

= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATTUDE = 40°06'37.20" (40.110333)
A = SECTTONCORNERSLOCATED. LONGITUDE=

109°35'25.97" (109.590547) HOT QUESTAREXPLR. &



SCALE: 1" = 50 QUESTAREXPLR & PROD.
DATE:07-16-o2 FIGURE #1
Drawn By: D.co× LOCATIONLAYOUTFOR

REVISED: 11-20-08 L.K. GH #13HG-17-8-21
SECTION 17, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M.

675' FSL 661' FWL
Proposed Access Û-' i.Û'
Road / 6& 7

Elare Pit-is to be located
a min. of 100' from the
We// Head

PIPE TUS

P PE RACKS
RARE Pir

.

C- 0.2'

B. 68.4
I l 170'| | 1 1 . S' Sta. 1+50El 68 -- ---

G-8.6
Atm.on;

RESERVE P/7S vm
(e' onop) ImT

UGHT PLANT '

PLMPHOUSE
L-...Jecosien

foto/ Pit Votume o
- M4¢ ¢u. Yds.

7TTTTTTTK s"T"o°i Ë
c-af ( ) GRADE

.: p 84'~. A e 635.) E/. 6Z7' Sta. 0+00
E/, 61.8' .

2.* ":'
-- ¯¯¯

C-: J.1
""' ""' 0-0.2' GRADE

E/. 67.9• EL 6Z7'

NOTES:
Bev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Stoke = 4668.4'

IIINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
F/H/SHED GRADEELEV AT LOC. STAKE = 466 Z 7 ,, ,,, 2,4 ,,,, . v,,...,. ,,,a ,447, . ,,,,,



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. FIGURE #
TYPICALCROSSSECTIONS FORX-Section

scale GH #13HG-17-8-21 Sti
SECTION17, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M. LAN

1" - so'
675' FSL 661' FWLDATE: 07-16-02

No. 16131Drawn By: D.COX
REVISED: 11-20-08 L.K. 35' 135' e RO

S TA. 3+25

10 70' 38' 135'

Location Stake

CUT

- STA. 1+50

10 70' 35' 135'

S/ope - / //2. /

Preconstruction
Grade Finished Grade

--- --
.... CUT GRADE

STA. 0+00

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES EXCESOWMAACTERINALAFTER
= J,690 Cu. Yds.

CUT Topsoil & Pit Backfill = J,690 Cu. Yds.
(12") Topsoil Stripping = 2,520 Cu. Yds- (1/2 Pit Vol.)
Remaining Locotion = 2,240 Cu. Yds. EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.

TOTALCUT = 4,760 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)

FILL = 1,020 CU.YDS. IIINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 Basi * Voimal, Utah 84078 * (486)



a..

PROPOSED LOCATION
GH #13HG-17-8-21

.

TSS
T9S

R R
20 21 ¯

E E . d'

LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.

O PROPOSED LOCATION N GH #13HG-17-&21
SECTION 17, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M.

675' FSL 661' FWL

- Uintah Engineedag & Land Surveying TOPOGR A rutc 7 1 02
85 Soutin 200 East Vernal, Utnis 84079 M A P m m(435) 789-1017 * FAX (.635) 789-1913

SCALE:1: 100 DREN BY:K.G REV:11-1408



7 8

I
L. s

18 17

PROPOSED LOCKl'IONOc GH #13HG-17-8-21 a.,
N A T I ON PROPOS ED ACCESS FOR THE

20 21

L

.

28

LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
PROPOSFD ACCESS ROAD N GH #13HG-17-8-2I
EXISTINGROAD SECTION 17, TSS, R2IE, S.L.B.& M.

-



o PROPOSED LOCATION 17Oc GH #13HG-17-8-21 H
NATl N

GN BRU

RR

28

LEGEND: QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
//DISPORALWKLLS WXTERWEU.8 N GH #13HG-17-&21
O PRODUC1NGWEU.5 ARANDONEDWEu.s SECTION 17, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.& M.

snoT mWEU.S # TEMPORARU.Y ABANDONED 675' FSL 661' FWL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGk A rurc 7 16 02
85 Souda 200 East Verna3. Utnia 84078 M A F asr mm(435) 789-102Y * FAX (435)



PR)RKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 11/24/2008 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-34723

WELL NAME: GHX 13HG-17-8-21

OPERATOR: QUESTAR EXPLORATION & ( 085 ) PHONE NUMBËR: 435-781-4331

CONTACT: LAURA BILLS

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SWSW 17 080S 210E .Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 0675 FSL 0661 FWL

BOTTOM: 2000 FNL 1000 FEL 26. Engineering

COUNTY: UINTAH Geology
LATITUDE: 40.11768 LONGITUDE: -109.5850

UTM SURF EASTINGS:620583 NORTHINGS: 4441568 Surface

FIELD NAME: GYPSUM HILLS ( 610 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: U-68219 PROPOSED FORMATION: GRRV

SURFACE OWNER: 2 - Indian COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

Plat R649-2-3. gg ggyckop
Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] ûnit: GYPSUM HILLS (GRRV)

'No. ESBOOOO24 )
Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception

No. 49-2153 )
RDCC Review (Y/N)

Drilling Unit

(Date: ) Board Cause No:
Eff Date:

A B Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

JA Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:

STIPULATIONS: 4
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(12/2/2008) Diana Mason - Gypsum Hill Page 1

United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
(UT-922)

December 2, 2008

Memorandum

To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2008 Plan of Development Gypsum Hills Unit Uintah County,
Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and Mining, and Mickey
Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land Management, the following horizontal re-
entries are planned for calendar year 2008 within the Gypsum Hills Unit, Uintah County,
Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ Green River/Horizontal)

43-047-32304 GH 9 Sec 20 TO8S R21E 2057 FNL 0663 FEL
LAT#1 Sec20 TOSS R21E 0010 FNL 2450 FWL
LAT#2 Sec 21 TO8S R21E 1000 FSL 0800 FWL

43-047-34723 GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Sec 17 TO8S R21E 0675 FSL 0661 FWL
LAT #1 Sec 19 TO8S R21E 2000 FNL 1000 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this time.

Is/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc: File - Gypsum Hills Unit
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid



g g
State of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES .

MICHAEL R. $TYLER

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR. ExecutiveDirector

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GARY.R. HERBERT JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

December 2, 2008

QuestarExploration & Production Co.
11002 E 17500 S
Vernal, UT 84078

Re: GHX 13HG-17-8-21Well, Surface Location 675' FSL, 661' FWL, SW SW, Sec. 17,
T. 8 South, R. 21 East, Bottom Location 2000' FNL, 1000' FEL, SE NE, Sec. 19,
T. 8 South, R. 21 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-34723.

Sincerely,

Gil Hunt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal Field Office

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 . facsimile (801) 359-3940 . TTY (801) 538-7458 •www.ogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &



Operator: QuestarExploration & Production Co.

Well Name & Number GHX 13HG-17-8-21

API Number: 43-047-34723
Lease: UTU-68219

Surface Location: SW SW Sec. 17 T. 8 South R. 21 East
Bottom Location: SE NE Sec. 19 T. 8 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281 (801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. In accordance with Utah Admin. R.649-3-11, Directional Drilling, the operator shall submit
a complete angular deviation and directional survey report to the Division within 30 days
following completion of the



API Well No: 43047347230000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-68219 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 UTE 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 GYPSUM HILLS (GRRV) 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 GHX 13HG-17-8-21 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO 

9. API NUMBER:
 43047347230000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 GYPSUM HILLS 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0675 FSL 0661 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

11/30/2009

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Questar Exploration and Production Company hereby requests a one year
extension for the APD on the above captioned well.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Jan Nelson

TITLE
 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 11/30/2009

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362  Ext 

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

November 30, 2009

iPI Well No: 43047347230000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING E6AS2E19DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS IFEINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. GYPSUM HILLS (GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well GHX 13HG-17-8-21

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO 43047347230000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-4362 Ext GYPSUM HILLS

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0675 FSL 0661 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 17 Township: 08.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

11/30/2009
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration and Production Company hereby requests a one year
extension for the APD on the above captioned well. Approved by the

Utah Division of
Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: November 30, 2009

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A



  

The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining

- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources

Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

Request for Permit Extension Validation Well Number 43047347230000
 

API: 43047347230000
Well Name: GHX 13HG-17-8-21 

Location: 0675 FSL 0661 FWL QTR SWSW SEC 17 TWNP 080S RNG 210E MER S
Company Permit Issued to: QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

Date Original Permit Issued: 12/2/2008

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted above, hereby verifies that
the information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not
require revision. Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface agreement been
updated?    Yes    No

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or
siting requirements for this location?    Yes    No

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation
of this proposed well?    Yes    No

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or rightof- way, which could
affect the proposed location?    Yes    No

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed?    Yes    No

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a
change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?    Yes    No

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well?    Yes    No

        
Signature:  Jan Nelson Date: 11/30/2009

Title:  Permit Agent Representing: QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

November 30, 2009November 30, 2009

November 30, 2009

UTAH

[ The Utah Division of Oil, Gas, and Mining
- State of Utah
- Department of Natural Resources
Electronic Permitting System - Sundry Notices

OTI GAS & MINTNG

Request for Permit Extension Validation Well Number 43047347230000

API: 43047347230000
Well Name: GHX 13HG-17-8-21

Location: 0675 FSL 0661 FWL QTR SWSW SEC 17 TWNP 080S RNG 210E MER S
Company Permit Issued to: QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO

Date Original Permit Issued: 12/2/2008

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drill on the property as permitted above, hereby verifies that
the information as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not
require revision. Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified.

• If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface agreement been
updated? I Yes I ) No

• Have any wells been drilled in the vicinity of the proposed well which would affect the spacing or
siting requirements for this location? I i Yes i i No

• Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation
of this proposed well?

_

I Yes i i No

•Have there been any changes to_the access route including ownership, or rightof- way, which could
affect the proposed location? I:_ I Yes I:BI No

• Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? I Yes I:¾) No

• Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which will require a
change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation? I i Yes i No

Approved by the
•Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? I i Yes . No Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
Signature: Jan Nelson Date: 11/30/2009

Title: Permit Agent Representing: QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTIO gg;e: November 30, 2009

By:

RECEIVED November 30,



API Well No: 43047347230000

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 U-68219 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO
DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 UTE 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
 GYPSUM HILLS (GRRV) 

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 GHX 13HG-17-8-21 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO 

9. API NUMBER:
 43047347230000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:  
 11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 GYPSUM HILLS 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     0675 FSL 0661 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 17 Township: 08.0S Range: 21.0E Meridian: S

COUNTY:
 UINTAH 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

   NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

3/7/2010

   SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

   SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

   DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE  

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE       WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 This sundry is being submitted to inform you that while drilling over the
weekend Questar Exploration and Production Company determined that the

target for the TD had to be extended by 678'feet for total depth of 8641'. The
new TD stays within unit boundaries.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT)  
 Jan Nelson

TITLE
 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3/15/2010

PHONE NUMBER:
435 781-4362  Ext 

EXTEND TD

 

PHONE NUMBER
435 781-4331

March 15, 2010

March 18, 2010

iPI Well No: 43047347230000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING E6AS2E19DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS IFEINDIAN,ALLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current
bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO 7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

DRILL form for such proposals. GYPSUM HILLS (GRRV)

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well GHX 13HG-17-8-21

2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO 43047347230000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
11002 East 17500 South , Vernal, UT, 84078 435 781-4362 Ext GYPSUM HILLS

4.LOCATIONOFWELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: UINTAH

0675 FSL 0661 FWL
QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

Qtr/Qtr: SWSW Section: 17 Township: 08.05 Range: 21.0E Meridian: S UTAH

11.
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

/ NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

3/7/2010
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION

O SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER: EXTEND TD

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR CC MPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

This sundry is being submitted to inform you that while drilling over the
weekend Questar Exploration and Production Company determined that the Approved by the

target for the TD had to be extended by 678'feet for total depth of 8641'. The Utah Division of
new TD stays within unit boundaries. Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: March 18, 2010

By:

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Jan Nelson 435 781-4331 Permit Agent

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/15/2010

RECEIVED March 15,
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TBS, R21E, S.L.B.&M QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
Well location, LATERAL 2 GH #13HG-17-8-21

's",f, "op at"u', a, eh P'r
ICo 7' (BOTTOM HOLE), located as shown in the SW 1/4

Stee/ Post O.T NLY Cop, Scottered Stones SW 1/4 of Section 17, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah
1950 Brass Cop,
Pile or stones SB9°50'26"W SB9°51'12"W County, Utah.

S89°42'40"W - 2617.40' (Meas.) 1319.93' (Meas.) 1319.56' (Meas.) BASIS OF ELEVATION
BENCH MARK 20EAM LOCATED IN THE SE 1/4 OF SECTION 35,
T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE OURAY SE, QUADRANGLE,
UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY, 7.5 MINUTE QUAD. (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP)
PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF THE

LOT 1 INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID ELEVATION IS MARKED AS
BEING 4697 FEET.

BASIS OF BEARINGS « »

BASIS OF BEARINGS IS A G.P.S. OBSERVATION.
L )

I

LOT 2
LA TERAL 2

1960 J" Brass Cap BO TTOM HOLE 990'
on Go/v. Pipe 1.4
High, Set Stone on .

East Side of Cop iJ
1967 Bross Cop
1.0' High, Private ^o ^o

Copperweld, 7wo o o
Large Stones

THE PROPOSED BOTTOM HOLE FOR THIS WELL
BERAORSSE2D8 OL1"HW3326.49' FROM THE

SCALE
LOT3

CERTIFICATE !!!
LA

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PREPA
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MA UN M
SUPERVISION AND THAT THE SAME A AND CORRECT T
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE AND BELIE

' No. 161319
O

LOT 4 REGIST DL DS OR
REVISED: 03-11-10 S.L• REGISTR

1967 Bross Cop 1967 Brass Cop 1967 Bross Cop D 1019-20-0082 L.D.COX STATE O kg O
1.O' High, Pile 1.0' High, Pi/e 1.0' High, Lorge
of Stones of Stones Stone ËÊ$$$$

L SB9°42'21"W
- 26J8.84' (Meas.)

n
SB922'41"W - 2665.48' (Meas.) UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING

85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078
LA TERAL 2 BOTTOM HOLE (435) 789-1017

(NAD 83)LEGEND' n SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:LATITUDE =
40°06'34.66 (40.109628) » .1 = 1000 07-11-02 07-16-02

LONGITUDE=
109°35'28.21" (109.591169)

=
90° SYMBOL PARTY REFERENCES

(NAD 27) D.A. J.A. D.COX G.L.O. PLATO = PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE =
40°06'34.79" (40.109664)

A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE=
109°35'25.72" (109.590478)

WEATHER

HOT UESTAR EXPLR. &



STATE OF UTAH AMENDEDREPORT O FORM 8
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES (highlightchanges)

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

U68219
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG UTE TRIBE
ia. TYPEOF WELL

L
8 DRY OTHER 7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME

GYPSUM HILLS
b. TYPE OF WORK' 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:

L*LL H D EP-
RY OTHER GHX 13HG 17-S-21

2. NAMEOF OPERATOlt 9. API NUMBER'

Questar Exploration &Production Company 4304734723
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10 FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT

11002 E 17500 8 Vernal UT 84078 (435) 781-4342 GYPSUM HILLS
4. LOCATIONOFWELL(FOOTAGES) 11. QTRIQTR SECT1ON,TOWNSHIP, RANGE,

ATSURFACE 675' FSL 661' FWL
MEUDIA :

SWSW 17 88 21E
ATTOPPRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELow 675' FSL, 661' FWL

«r TOTALDEFTH: 675' FSL, 661' FWL
Ucl

TH UTAH

14. DATE SPUDDED: 15. DATET.D. REACHED: 16. DATECOMPLETED: 17. ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

4/9/2003 3/6/2010 3/2312010 AMONED READYTOPRODUCE O 14 KB
18. TOTALDEPTH: MD g g) 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 8,532 20 IF MULTIPLECOMPLETIONS, HOW MANY?* 21. DEPTH BRIDGE MD

PLUGSET:
Tvo 5.283 Tvo Tvo

22. TYPE ELECTRICANDOTHER MECHANCALLOGSRUN (Submit copy ofeach)
WELLCORED? NO YES (S mRæaWs)

No current logs have been run on this horizontal lateral #2
OST RUN? NO YES (SMR æpo

ECTIONALSURVEY? NO YES (Submitcopy)

24. CASINGANDLINERRECORD (Report alistdags set in well)

HOLESI2E SizEfGRADE WEIGHT (Wit.) TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) STAGE C ENTER ŒNO
O S VOL BBL) CEMENT TOP " AMOUNTPULLED

6.125 4.5 0110 11.6 5,601 8,532
6.125 4.5 nSD 11.6 5,601 8,532

25. TUBINGRECORD

SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET(MD) PACKER SET (MD} SIZE DEFTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

2.875 5,130
26. PRODUCINGINTERVALS 27. PERFORATION RECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP (MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP (TVD) BOTTOM(TVD} INTERVAL(TopiBat-MD) SlZE NO.HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(A) Gm Rvr G-1 Lime 4,778 4,784 4,790 8,532 4.5 oven Sguee2ed

(B) Open Squeezed

(C) Open Squeezed

(D) Open md

20. ACID, FRACTURE,TREATMENT,CEMENT SQUEEzE, ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTANDTYPE OF MATERIAL

5828' - 8525' Pumped 35,000 palsof 15% HCL acid

29. ENCLOSEDATTACHMENTS: 30.WELLSTATUS:

O ELECTRICAUMECHANICALLOGS O GEOLOGIC REPORT DST REPORT O DIRECTIONALSURVEY producingO SUNDRYNOTICEFORPLUGOINGANDGEMENTVERIFICATION COREANAt.YSB ONER.

(saooo' RECEIVED (CONTINUEDON BACK)

JUN1 0 2010

DIV.OFOIL,GAS&



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in Itim #28)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE HOURS TESTED: ST PRODUCTION OIL - BBC - MCF: WATER-BBL: PROD. METHOD

3/22/2010 3/24/2010 24 - 267 0 174 pumping
CHOKE SIZE: TBG.PRESS. CSG. PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU-GAS GASiOILRATIO24 HR PRODUCTION OIL- BBC - MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS

250 40 RATES:

INTiiRVALB (As shown in item #28)

DATEFIRSTPRODUCED: TEST DATE: HOURS TESTED: ST PRODUCTION IL-BBL - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD.METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKESIZE TBG.PRESS. CSG.PRESS. APIGRAVITY BTU-GAS GASIOILRATIO24HRPRODUCTION IL-BBL -MCF: WATER-BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES:

INTERVALC (As shown in item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: ST DATE: HOURSTESTED: ST PRODUCTION OIL-BBL: GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: ->

CHOKESIZE TBG.PRESS. SG.PRESS, APIGRAVITY BTU-GAS GAStolLRATIO24HRPRODUCTION OIL-BBL GAS-MCF: WATER-BBL: 1NTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: ->

INTERVALD (As shown in Item #26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED- TEST DATE HOURS TESTED: ST PRODUCTION OIL - BBL: GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -+

CHOKE Sl2E: TBG. PRESS. CSG.PRESS. API GRAVITY BTU-GAS ASIDILRATIO 24 HR PRODUCTION DIL - BBL GAS- MCF: WATER - BBL: INTERVALSTATUS:
RATES: -+

32. DISPOSITIONOFOAS(Sold,UsedforFuel,Vented, Etc.]

Sold
35. SUMMARYOFPOROUS2ONES(luciudeAquifers): 34 FORMATION(Log)MARKERS:

Show allimportant zonesofporosily andcontenisthereofCored intervals and allddll-stem tests, including depth interval
tested, cushionused, time toolopen,flowingand shuainpressures and recoverles.

Fonnation Descriptions, Contents,etc Nm (Measu a Depth)

35. ADDMONALREMARK (Insiudeplugg igprocedwe)

Green River G-1 Lime - Completed Lateral #2 - #27: Perforated Liner allemating jts of blank & perforated fl 5601-8532.

38. I herebycertifythatthotoregoing and stisched InformaBon is complete and correct as determined from allavailableswoords,

NAME ( SE PRIN Dah I Wi.E OfficeAdministrator

SIGNATURE DATE 6/10/2010
III I I

This reportmust be submittedwithin30 days of
• completing or plugging a newweil • reentering a prevîously plugged and abandoned well
• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existingwell bore • significantlydeepening an existing well bore below theprevious bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydrocarbon exploratoryholes, such as core samples and stratigraphic tests

*lTEM 20: Show thenumberofcompletionsif production is measured separately from twoor moreformations.

** ITEM24:CementTop-Show howreportedtop(s) of cement were determined (circulated{CIR),calculated(CAL),cementbondlog (CBL),temperaturesurvey(TS))

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil, Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Salt Lake City,Utah 84114-5801



RECEIVED
JUN 1 1 2010

GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Re-EntrylftiekidiurneyaSurvey Report
Report Date: June 11,2010 SurveyIDLSComputationMethod: MinimumCurvature/ Lubinski

Client: VerticalSectionAzimuth: 209.470°
Field: Uinta VerticalSectionOrigin: N0.000ft,E0.000ft

StructureI Slot: GypsumHills/ GHX13HG-17-8-21 TVDReference Datum: KB
Well: GHX13HG-17-8-21 TVDReference Elevation: 4684.5ftrelativetoMSL

Borehole: Re-Entry SeaBed IGroundLevelElevation: 4718.000ft relativetoMSL
UWIIAPI#: MagneticDeclination: 11.867°

SurveyNameI Date: GHX13HG-17-8-21Re-EntryFieldSurveylFebruary23, 2010 Total Field Strength: 52974.636nT
Tort IAHDI DDII ERDratio: 225.598°l 3693.91ft/ 6.130/ 0.696 Magnetic Dip: 66.100°

GridCoordinateSystem: NAD83UtahState Planes,CentralZone,USFeet Declination Date: February23,2010
Location LatlLong: N40 7 3.590,W109357.920 MagneticDeclination Model: IGRF2005

Location GridNIEYlX: N7217313.014ftUS,E2175769.108ftUS North Reference: TrueNorth
GridConvergenceAngle: +1.22636637' Total CorrMagNorth -> True North: +11.867°

GridScaleFactor: 0.99991096 Local CoordinatesReferenced To: WellHead

Comments MeDaspurhed Inclination Azimuth TVD c NS EW Closure DLS Tool Face Northing Easting

(ft) (deg) (deg) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (deg) (deg1100ft) (deg) (ftUS) (ftUS)
Projected-Up 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 '0.00M 7217313.01 2175769.11

18.50 0.00 0.00 18.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00M 7217313.01 2175769.11
42.40 0.00 0.00 42.40 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00M 7217313.01 2175769.11
47.80 0.00 0.00 47.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00M 7217313.01 2175769.11
78.10 0.00 0.00 78.10 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 160.40M 7217313.01 2175769.11

519.00 0.40 160.40 519.00 1.01 -1.45 0.52 1.54 160.40 0.09 77.10M 7217311.58 2175769.66
641.00 0.60 77.10 640.99 0.86 -1.71 1.28 2.14 143.12 0.56 73.50M 7217311.33 2175770.43
764.00 1.40 73.50 763.97 -0.66 -1.14 3.35 3.54 108.76 0.65 31.10M 7217311.95 2175772.48

2141.00 2.10 31.10 2140.38 -37.97 25.24 32.51 41.16 52.17 0.10 32.80M 7217338.95 2175801.07
2343.00 1.80 32.80 2342.26 -44.84 31.08 36.14 47.67 49.31 0.15 -52.00M 7217344.86 2175804.57

2775.00 1.50 308.00 2774.13 -52.45 40.26 35.36 53.59 41.29 0.52 -62.30M 7217354.02 2175803.60
2870.00 1.70 297.70 2869.10 -52.59 41.69 33.13 53.25 38.48 0.37 -37.50M 7217355.40 2175801.34
2966.00 2.40 322.50 2965.04 -53.34 43.94 30.65 53.58 34.90 1.16 -45.50M 7217357.60 2175798.81
3155.00 2.60 314.50 3153.86 -56.00 50.09 25.18 56.06 26.69 0.21 -24.50M 7217363.62 2175793.21
3282.00 1.70 335.50 3280.77 -57.85 53.82 22.35 58.28 22.55 0.93 11.60M 7217367.29 2175790.30

3409.00 2.60 11.60 3407.68 -61.70 58.36 22.15 62.42 20.78 1.25 33.00M 7217371.83 2175790.00
3598.00 3.50 33.00 3596.42 -71.54 67.39 26.15 72.29 21.21 0.76 30.50M 7217380.95 2175793.81
3661.00 3.20 30.50 3659.31 -75.22 70.52 28.09 75.91 21.72 0.53 36.60M 7217384.11 2175795 68
3788.00 3.50 36.60 3786.09 -82.61 76.69 32.20 83.17 22.78 0.37 37.60M 7217390.37 2175799.ß6
3852.00 4.00 37.60 3849.96 -86.76 80.03 34.73 87.24 23.46 0.79 38.50M 7217393.76 2175802.11

3914.00 4.40 38.50 3911.79 -91.25 83.60 37.53 91.64 24.17 0.65 39.90M 7217397.39 2175804.83
3977.00 4.10 39.90 3974.62 -95.85 87.22 40.48 96.15 24.89 0.50 51.50M 7217401.07 2175807.70
4105.00 4.40 51.50 4102.27 -104.90 93.79 47.25 105.02 26.74 0.71 53.00M 7217407.78 2175814.34
4168.00 4.40 53.00 4165.08 -109.35 96.74 51.08 109.40 27.83 0.18 48.20M 7217410.82 2175818.10
4232.00 4.50 48.20 4228.89 -113.98 99.90 54.91 113.99 28.80 0.60 41.80M 7217414.05 2175821.86

4295.00 4.60 41.80 4291.69 -118.79 103.43 58.43 118.79 29.47 0.82 35.70M 7217417.66 2175825.31
4358.00 5.10 35.70 4354.47 -124.04 107.58 61.75 124.05 29.86 1.14 -6.68G 7217421.88 2175828.54
4421.00 5.60 35.10 4417.19 -129.89 112.37 65.15 129.89 30.11 0.80 159.09G 7217426.74 2175831.84
4484.00 4.80 38.80 4479.93 -135.55 116.94 68.57 135.56 30.39 1.38 48.10M 7217431.39 2175835.16
4547.00 4.80 48.10 4542.71 -140.65 120.76 72.19 140.69 30.87 1.23 49.80M 7217435.28 2175838.69

4610.00 5.50 49.80 4605.46 -145.97 124.47 76.45 146.07 31.56 1.14 -15.85G 7217439.08 2175842.87
4674.00 6.70 46.90 4669.09 -152.41 129.00 81.52 152.60 32.29 1.94 -32.85G 7217443.71 2175847.84
4736.00 7.30 43.90 4730.63 -159.68 134.31 86.90 159.96 32.90 1.13 15.41G 7217449.14 2175853.10
4767.00 7.90 45.10 4761.36 -163.64 137.23 89.77 163.98 33.19 2.00 -8.00G 7217452.12 2175855.91

Tie-In 4790.00 8.08 44.92 4764.14 -166.72 139.49 92.03 167.11 33.42 0.79 165.37G 7217454.43 2175858.12

4838.00 4.80 185.40 4831.99 -168.14 139.88 94.23 168.66 33.97 25.35 -167.70M 7217454.87 2175860.32
4870.00 10.70 192.30 4863.69 -164.08 135.64 93.47 164.73 34.57 18.63 2.22G 7217450.61 2175859.65
4901.00 16.60 193.10 4893.80 -157.07 128.51 91.85 157.96 35.56 19.04 -6.22G 7217443.45 2175858.18
4933.00 21.70 191.60 4924.02 -147.05 118.26 89.63 148.38 37.16 16.01 -12.56G 7217433.15 2175856.18
4964.00 24.50 190.10 4952.53 -135.53 106.31 87.35 137.59 39.41 9.23 -2.97G 7217421.16 2175854.15

4996.00 26.20 189.90 4981.45 -122.61 92.82 84.97 125.84 42.47 5.32 48.05G 7217407.62 2175852 06
5028.00 27.80 193.60 5009.96 -108.78 78.60 82.00 113.59 46.21 7.25 44.93G 7217393.35 2175849.40
5060.00 29.80 197.50 5038.00 -93.82 63.77 77.85 100.63 50.68 8.57 26.89G 7217378.43 2175845.57
5092.00 31.90 199.50 5065.48 -77.71 48.21 72.64 87.18 56.43 7.30 38.65G 7217362.76 2175840.69
5124.00 33.00 201.10 5092.48 -60.76 32.11 66.68 74.01 64.29 4.36 -40.25G 7217346.54 2175835.08
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5156.00 34.00 199.60 5119.16 -43.32 15.55 60.54 62.51 75.60 4.06 -48.14G 7217329.85 2175829.30
5188.00 35.10 197.50 5145.52 -25.51 -1.65 54.77 54.80 91.73 5.07 -26.97G 7217312.53 2175823.90
5218.00 37.90 195.20 5169.63 -8.13 -18.78 49.76 53.19 110.67 10.39 24.22G 7217295.31 2175819.26
5250.00 41.30 197.50 5194.29 11.73 -38.34 44.01 58.37 131.06 11.57 5.97G 7217275.63 2175813.92
5282.00 46.90 198.30 5217.26 33.54 -59.52 37.16 70.17 148.02 17.59 8.55G 7217254.31 2175807.53

5313.00 51.60 199.20 5237.49 56.61 -81.75 29.60 86.94 160.09 15.32 4.62G 7217231.92 2175800.45
5345.00 57.90 199.80 5255.95 82.33 -106.37 20.88 108.40 168.89 19.75 5.81G 7217207.13 2175792.26
5377.00 64.10 200.50 5271.46 109.94 -132.63 11.24 133.10 175.16 19.47 4.41G 7217180.67 2175783.18
5409.00 71.50 201.10 5283.54 139.21 -160.30 0.72 160.31 179.74 23.19 0.00G 7217152.78 2175773.26
5440.00 77.00 201.10 5291.95 168.71 -188.13 -10.01 188.40 183.05 17.74 -14.95G 7217124.73 2175763.12

5473.00 78.10 200.80 5299.06 200.58 -218.22 -21.54 219.28 185.64 3.45 6.94G 7217094.40 2175752.25
5504.00 83.00 201.40 5304.15 230.83 -246.74 -32.54 248.88 187.51 15.92 -1.77G 7217065.65 2175741.86
5537.00 89.50 201.20 5306.31 263.40 -277.41 -44.50 280.95 189.11 19.71 -30.96G 7217034.74 2175730.56
5568.00 90.00 200.90 5306.45 294.07 -306.34 -55.63 311.35 190.29 1.88 168.69G 7217005.58 2175720.05
5600.00 89.00 201.10 5306.72 325.72 -336.21 -67.10 342.84 191.29 3.19 173.67G 7216975.48 2175709.23

5631.00 86.30 201.40 5308.00 356.37 -365.08 -78.32 373.38 192.11 8.76 0.00G 7216946.38 2175698.62
5664.00 87.40 201.40 5309.81 389.00 -395.75 -90.35 405.93 192.86 3.33 -4.58G 7216915.45 2175687.26
5696.00 89.90 201.20 5310.56 420.66 -425.56 -101.97 437.60 193.47 7.84 -9.46G 7216885.41 2175676.28
5727.00 91.10 201.00 5310.29 451.33 -454.48 -113.13 468.34 193.98 3.92 -31.99G 7216856.26 2175665.74
5760.00 91.90 200.50 5309.43 483.93 -485.32 -124.81 501.12 194.42 2.86 23.18G 7216825.17 2175654.72

5791.00 92.60 200.80 5308.21 514.54 -514.31 -135.74 531.92 194.78 2.46 143.13G 7216795.96 2175644.42
5823.00 91.40 201.70 5307.09 546.19 -544.12 -147.33 563.71 195.15 4.69 139.08G 7216765.92 2175633.47
5855.00 89.90 203.00 5306.73 577.94 -573.71 -159.49 595.47 195.54 6.20 -125.54G 7216736.08 2175621.94
5886.00 89.40 202.30 5306.92 608.72 -602.32 -171.43 626.24 195.89 2.77 -26.56G 7216707.22 2175610.62
5918.00 89.80 202.10 5307.14 640.47 -631.94 -183.52 658.05 196.19 1.40 7.12G 7216677.34 2175599.17

5949.00 90.60 202.20 5307.04 671.21 -660.66 -195.21 688.89 196.46 2.60 28.60G 7216648.39 2175588.10
5981.00 91.70 202.80 5306.39 702.97 -690.21 -207.45 720.72 196.73 3.92 -168.69G 7216618.58 2175576.49
6012.00 91.20 202.70 5305.61 733.75 -718.79 -219.44 751.54 196.98 1.64 145.61G 7216589.76 2175565.12
6044.00 89.30 204.00 5305.47 765.56 -748.17 -232.12 783.35 197.24 7.19 39.81G 7216560.12 2175553.07
6076.00 89.90 204.50 5305.69 797.43 -777.34 -245.26 815.12 197.51 2.44 51.84G 7216530.67 2175540.56

6105.00 91.00 205.90 5305.47 826.35 -803.58 -257.61 843.86 197.77 6.14 90.00G 7216504.18 2175528.78
6131.00 91.00 206.70 5305.01 852.30 -826.89 -269.13 869.58 198.03 3.08 78.68G 7216480.63 2175517.76
6163.00 91.10 207.20 5304.42 884.27 -855.41 -283.63 901.20 198.34 1.59 63.43G 7216451.81 2175503.88
6194.00 91.20 207.40 5303.80 915.24 -882.95 -297.84 931.83 198 64 0.72 -44.98G 7216423.97 2175490.26
6226.00 91.70 206.90 5302.99 947.20 -911.41 -312.44 963.48 198.92 2.21 140.71G 7216395.21 2175476.27

6258.00 90.60 207.80 5302.35 979.17 -939.83 -327.14 995.14 199.19 4.44 161.57G 7216366.48 2175462.19
6289.00 88.80 208.40 5302.51 1010.16 -967.17 -341.74 1025.77 199.46 6.12 60.26G 7216338.84 2175448.18
6321.00 89.20 209.10 5303.07 1042.15 -995.23 -357.13 1057.36 199.74 2.52 33.69G 7216310.46 2175433.39
6353.00 89.80 209.50 5303.35 1074.15 -1023.13 -372.79 1088.93 200.02 2.25 12.53G 7216282.23 2175418.33
6385.00 90.70 209.70 5303.21 1106.15 -1050.95 -388.59 1120.50 200.29 2.88 -36.86G 7216254.08 2175403.13

6416.00 91.10 209.40 5302.72 1137.15 -1077.92 -403.88 1151.10 200.54 1.61 -18.43G 7216226.80 2175388.42
6448.00 91.40 209.30 5302.03 1169.14 -1105.80 -419.56 1182.72 200.78 0.99 18.43G 7216198.59 2175373.35
6480.00 91.70 209.40 5301.16 1201.13 -1133.69 -435.24 1214.36 201.00 0.99 -59.01G 7216170.38 2175358.27
6511.00 92.00 208.90 5300.16 1232.11 -1160.75 -450.33 1245.04 201.20 1.88 -174.81G 7216143.00 2175343.76
6544.00 90.90 208.80 5299.32 1265.10 -1189.64 -466.25 1277.75 201.40 3.35 93.15G 7216113.78 2175328.47

6575.00 90.70 212.40 5298.89 1296.08 -1216.32 -482.03 1308.35 201.62 11.63 -44.99G 7216086.77 2175313.27
6607.00 91.20 211.90 5298.36 1328.04 -1243.41 -499.05 1339.82 201.87 2.21 63.43G 7216059.33 2175296.83
6639.00 91.30 212.10 5297.66 1360.00 -1270.54 -516.01 1371.32 202.10 0.70 -161.56G 7216031.84 2175280.46
6671.00 89.80 211.60 5297.36 1391.97 -1297.72 -532.89 1402.87 202.32 4.94 101.31G 7216004.31 2175264.16
6702.00 89.70 212.10 5297.49 1422.95 -1324.05 -549.25 1433.45 202.53 1.64 -45.00G 7215977.64 2175248.37

6734.00 89.90 211.90 5297.60 1454.92 -1351.19 -566.21 1465.02 202.74 0.88 -72.90G 7215950.14 2175232.00
6767.00 90.30 210.60 5297.55 1487.90 -1379.40 -583.33 1497.67 202.92 4.12 107.10G 7215921.57 2175215.49
6798.00 89.90 211.90 5297.49 1518.88 -1405.90 -599.41 1528.35 203.09 4.39 175.60G 7215894.74 2175199.98
6829.00 88.60 212.00 5297.90 1549.85 -1432.20 -615.81 1558.98 203.27 4.21 -63.44G 7215868.09 2175184.15
6862.00 89.00 211.20 5298.59 1582.82 -1460.30 -633.10 1591.63 203.44 2.71 21.80G 7215839.63 2175167.46

6895.00 89.50 211.40 5299.02 1615.80 -1488.49 -650.24 1624.32 203.60 1.63 70.71G 7215811.08 2175150.93
6926.00 90.20 213.40 5299.10 1646.76 -1514.67 -666.85 1654.96 203.76 6.84 -57.52G 7215784.56 2175134.89
6958.00 90.90 212.30 5298.79 1678.70 -1541.55 -684.21 1686.57 203.93 4.07 56.29G 7215757.32 2175118.11
6990.00 91.70 213.50 5298.07 1710.63 -1568.41 -701.58 1718.17 204.10 4.51 116.56G 7215730.09 2175101.31
7022.00 91.40 214.10 5297.20 1742.53 -1594.99 -719.38 1749.71 204.28 2.10 0.00G 7215703.14 2175084.09

7053.00 91.80 214.10 5296.34 1773.42 -1620.65 -736.75 1780.26 204.45 1.29 132.87G 7215677.12 2175067.28
7085.00 90.50 215.50 5295.69 1805.27 -1646.92 -755.01 1811.74 204.63 5.97 -140.19G 7215650.46 2175049.59
7116.00 89.90 215.00 5295.59 1836.11 -1672.24 -772.90 1842.21 204.81 2.52 64.98G 7215624.77 2175032.24
7148.00 90.60 216.50 5295.45 1867.92 -1698.21 -791.60 1873.64 204.99 5.17 -126.87G 7215598.41 2175014.11
7180.00 90.30 216.10 5295.20 1899.69 -1723.99 -810.54 1905.03 205.18 1.56 90.00G 7215572.23 2174995.72

7211.00 90.30 216.90 5295.03 1930.46 -1748.91 -828.98 1935.43 205.36 2.58 -123.69G 7215546.92 2174977.82
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7216.00 90.10 216.60 5295.02 1935.42 -1752.92 -831.97 1940.34 205.39 7.21 56.30G 7215542.85 2174974.92
7248.00 90.90 217.80 5294.74 1967.12 -1778.41 -851.32 1971.67 205.58 4.51 -164.36G 7215516.96 2174956.12
7280.00 88.40 217.10 5294.93 1998.81 -1803.81 -870.77 2002.99 205.77 8.11 143.18G 7215491.15 2174937.22
7312.00 86.80 218.30 5296.27 2030.45 -1829.10 -890.32 2034.28 205.95 6.25 -85.63G 7215465.44 2174918.21

7344.00 86.90 217.00 5298.03 2062.08 -1854.40 -909.84 2065.58 206.13 4.07 -75.96G 7215439.73 2174899.24
7376.00 87.00 216.60 5299.73 2093.77 -1879.99 -928.98 2096.99 206.30 1.29 -20.78G 7215413.75 2174880.66
7407.00 89.90 215.50 5300.57 2124.55 -1905.04 -947.22 2127.53 206.44 10.00 -30.93G 7215388.31 2174862.96
7439.00 93.40 213.40 5299.65 2156.41 -1931.41 -965.31 2159.20 206.56 12.75 110.56G 7215361.56 2174845.44
7471.00 93.10 214.20 5297.84 2188.27 -1957.96 -983.08 2190.90 206.66 2.67 80.51G 7215334.64 2174828.24

7502.00 93.20 214.80 5296.13 2219.10 -1983.47 -1000.61 2221.57 206.77 1.96 -168.69G 7215308.77 2174811.26
7534.00 91.20 214.40 5294.90 2250.95 -2009.79 -1018.77 2253.25 206.88 6.37 116.56G 7215282.07 2174793.68
7565.00 90.70 215.40 5294.39 2281.81 -2035.21 -1036.50 2283.95 206.99 3.61 -158.20G 7215256.27 2174776.49
7597.00 90.20 215.20 5294.14 2313.64 -2061.32 -1054.99 2315.61 207.10 1.68 146.31G 7215229.77 2174758.57
7628.00 89.90 215.40 5294.11 2344.48 -2086.62 -1072.91 2346.30 207.21 1.16 33.69G 7215204.10 2174741.20

7660.00 90.20 215.60 5294.08 2376.30 -2112.68 -1091.49 2377.97 207.32 1.13 -78.69G 7215177.66 2174723.18
7692.00 90.50 214.10 5293.89 2408.16 -2138.94 -1109.77 2409.70 207.42 4.78 41.18G 7215151.01 2174705.46
7724.00 91.30 214.80 5293.39 2440.03 -2165.32 -1127.87 2441.46 207.51 3.32 0.00G 7215124.25 2174687.94
7756.00 91.30 214.80 5292.66 2471.89 -2191.59 -1146.13 2473.19 207.61 0.00 0.00G 7215097.60 2174670.25
7788.00 91.50 214.80 5291.88 2503.74 -2217.86 -1164.39 2504.94 207.70 0.62 -174.81G 7215070.95 2174652.56

7820.00 90.40 214.70 5291.35 2535.60 -2244.15 -1182.63 2536.69 207.79 3.45 -124.99G 7215044.28 2174634.89
7851.00 89.70 213.70 5291.32 2566.49 -2269.79 -1200.05 2567.50 207.87 3.94 80.54G 7215018.27 2174618.02
7883.00 89.90 214.90 5291.43 2598.38 -2296.22 -1218.08 2599.30 207.94 3.80 0.00G 7214991.46 2174600.56
7915.00 90.30 214.90 5291.38 2630.23 -2322.47 -1236.39 2631.07 208.03 1.25 21.80G 7214964.83 2174582.82
7947.00 90.80 215.10 5291.07 2662.08 -2348.68 -1254.74 2662.83 208.11 1.68 -135.00G 7214938.24 2174565.03

7978.00 89.90 214.20 5290.88 2692.96 -2374.18 -1272.37 2693.63 208.19 4.11 -153.44G 7214912.37 2174547.96
8010.00 89.70 214.10 5290.99 2724.85 -2400.66 -1290.33 2725.46 208.26 0.70 48.81G 7214885.51 2174530.56
8042.00 90.40 214.90 5290.96 2756.73 -2427.03 -1308.46 2757.27 208.33 3.32 36.86G 7214858.76 2174513.01
8074.00 91.60 215.80 5290.40 2788.55 -2453.13 -1326.97 2789.03 208.41 4.69 -172.40G 7214832.27 2174495.06
8106.00 90.10 215.60 5289.93 2820.36 -2479.11 -1345.64 2820.77 208.49 4.73 -90.00G 7214805.90 2174476.95

8138.00 90.10 215.50 5289.87 2852.18 -2505.15 -1364.24 2852.53 208.57 0.31 -63.43G 7214779.47 2174458.91
8169.00 90.40 214.90 5289.74 2883.02 -2530.48 -1382.11 2883.32 208.64 2.16 0.00G 7214753.77 2174441.59
8201.00 91.10 214.90 5289.32 2914.88 -2556.72 -1400.42 2915.13 208.71 2.19 -111.80G 7214727.14 2174423.85
8233.00 90.90 214.40 5288.76 2946.74 -2583.04 -1418.61 2946.96 208.78 1.68 -156.04G 7214700.44 2174406.23
8265.00 90.00 214.00 5288.51 2978.63 -2609.51 -1436.60 2978.81 208.83 3.08 150.26G 7214673.60 2174388.82

8297.00 89.30 214.40 5288.71 3010.52 -2635.97 -1454.58 3010.67 208.89 2.52 81.87G 7214646.76 2174371.40
8329.00 89.40 215.10 5289.07 3042.38 -2662.26 -1472.82 3042.51 208.95 2.21 -33.69G 7214620.08 2174353.73
8361.00 89.70 214.90 5289.32 3074.23 -2688.47 -1491.18 3074.33 209.02 1.13 39.81G 7214593.49 2174335.94
8392.00 90.30 215.40 5289.32 3105.08 -2713.82 -1509.02 3105.15 209.08 2.52 -65.22G 7214567.77 2174318.65
8425.00 90.90 214.10 5288.97 3137.94 -2740.93 -1527.83 3137.99 209.14 4.34 44.99G 7214540.26 2174300.42

8456.00 91.10 214.30 5288.43 3168.83 -2766.57 -1545.25 3168.87 209.19 0.91 104.03G 7214514.26 2174283.56
8488.00 91.00 214.70 5287.85 3200.70 -2792.94 -1563.37 3200.72 209.24 1.29 -75.95G 7214487.51 2174266.00
8520.00 91.30 213.50 5287.21 3232.59 -2819.43 -1581.31 3232.60 209.29 3.86 44.98G 7214460.65 2174248.64
8552.00 91.80 214.00 5286.34 3264.49 -2846.03 -1599.08 3264.50 209.33 2.21 50.17G 7214433.68 2174231.44
8584.00 92.30 214.60 5285.19 3296.35 -2872.44 -1617.10 3296.36 209.38 2.44 123.71G 7214406.88 2174213.99

Last Survey 8594.00 92.10 214.90 5284.81 3306.30 -2880.65 -1622.80 3306.30 209.39 3.60 0.00G 7214398.55 2174208.48
To MD 8641.00 92.10 214.90 5283.09 3353.06 -2919.18 -1649.67 3353.06 209.47 0.00 0.00G 7214359.47 2174182.44

Survey Type: Non-Def Survey

Survey Error Model: SLB ISCWSA version 22 *** 3-D 95.00% Confidence 2.7955 sigma
Survevina Pron:

MD From ( ft) MD To (ft) EOU Freq Survey Tool Type Borehole -> Survey
-33.50 0.00 Act-Stns SLB_MWD-STD Original Hole -> GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Field Survey

0.00 4790.00 Act-Stns SLB_MWD-STD Original Hole -> GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Field Survey
4790.00 8594.00 Act-Stns SLB_MWD-STD Re-Entry-> GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Re-Entry Field Survey

*Italicized stations are NOT used in position calculations.
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Operations Summary Report 'O

Well Name: GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Spud Date: 6/1/2003
Location 17- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2010
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

Date From - To Hours Code e Description of Operations

2/18/2010 06:00 - 18:30 12.50 LOC 3 RIGDOWN AND MOVE RIGTO NEW LOCATION, 100% RIGGED DOWN, 100%
SET IN, 50% RIGGED UP, BOILER RIGGED UP AND ON LINE, ELECTRICAL
LEADS, WIND WALLS

18:30 -06:00 11.50 LOC 4 50 % RIGGED UP, BOILER RIGGED UP AND ONLlÑE, FUEL WATER AND AIR
SYSTEMSRIGGED UP, WIND WALLS,STAIRS AND HANDRAILS UP, MISC
HOSES AÑD ELECTRICAL RIGGED UP. WILL RAISE DERRICK THIS AM

2/19/2010 06:00 -06:00 24.00 LOC 4 RAISE DERRICK, RIGREPAIR: WORK ON DRAWWORKS, MUD PUMPS AND
RACKING FLOOR
STACK UP BOP AND MODIFY FLOW LINE,lNSTALLED NATURAL GAS LINETO
BOILER AND FIRED ON SAME, RIG UP GAS BUSTER AND FLARE LINES

2/20/2010 06:00 - 18:00 12.00 RIG 2 RIG REPAIR: REPAIR DRAWWORKS WATER CIRCULATINGSYSTEM,
REPAIRMUD PUMP#1 OILER SYSTEM AND RIG UP TOP DRIVE

18:00 - 23:00 5.00 BOP 1 NIPPLE UP BOP - RIG ON DAYRATE @18:00 HRS 2/19/2010
E-MAIL BOP ÑOTIFICATION SENT TO UTAH BLM ON 2/19/2009 @14:00,LEFT
VOICE MESSAGE WITH JAMIE
NOTIFIED UTAH DEPT. OF NAUURAL RESOURCES OIL AND GAS DIV, VICKI
DYSON ON 2/18/2010 @08:00OF MOVE ON RIG UP

23:00 - 04:00 5.00 BOP 2 RIG UP TESTERS AND HELD SAFETY MEETING, TEST BOP, DART AND
FLOOR VALVES, TOPDRIVE DOUBLE BALLVALVE, PIPE RAMS,CHECK
VALVE, CHOKE VALVES AND CHOKE MANIFOLD TO 3000 PSI, ANNULAR TO
1500 PSI, RIG DOWN TESTERS

04:00 -05:00 1.00 TRP 1 HELD SAFETY MEETING, RIG UP LAYDOWN MACHINE
05:00 -05:30 0.50 OTH INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 TRP 1 P/U BHA

2/21/2010 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 TRP 2 PICK UP DRILLSTRING,TAG RBP @479T
11:00 -11:30 0.50 CIRC 1 RIGDOWN LAYDOWN TRUCK AND CIRCULATE
11:30 -13:00 1.50 HOT 1 RIG UP HOT OILER AND CIRCULATE HOLE WITH 200 DEGREE WATER
13:00 - 14:30 1.50 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE TO HWDP
14:30 - 16:00 1.50 RIG 6 CUT DRILLINGLINE
16:00 - 18:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP ÖUT OF THE HOLE
18:00 -20:00 2.00 TRP 1 LAY DOWN BIT, CASINGSCRAPER AND BIT SUB, P/U WHIPSTOCKIMILLING

ASSEMBLY AND ORIENT
20:00 -22:30 2.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN THE HOLE WITH WHIPSTOCK AND MILLINGASSEMBLY
22:30 -23:30 1.00 LOG 4 RIG UP WlRELINE TRUCK AND RUN IN THE HOLE WITH GYROTOOL
23:30 - 00:00 0.50 LOG 4 ORIENT AND SET WHIPSTOCK AT 212 DEGREES, TOP OF WHIPSTOCK

@4778'
00:00 - 00:30 0.50 LOG 4 PULL OUT OF THE HOLE WITH GYRO TOOL AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE

TRUCK
00;30 -06:00 5.50 FISH 1 ADJUST TOPDRIVE TORQUES FOR MILLINGANDMILLWINDOWFROM 4778'

TO 4784
206 GPM 2-5 WOB

2/22/2010 06:00 - 13:30 7.50 DRL 2 MILLWINDOW AND 5' OF NEW HOLE
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE HIGH VISSWEEP
14:00 - 16:30 2.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE TO PUCKUP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 TRP 1 LAY DOWN MILLINGASSEMBLY ( WINDOW MILL 3/16 OUT FOLLOW MILL1/16

OUT)

17:00 - 17:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
17:30 -20:00 2.50 TRP 1 PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLSAND0RIENT, SURFACE TEST MOTOR
20;00 - 20:30 0.50 OTH CHANGE OUT GRABBER DIES AND RESET DRILLINGTORQUE ON TOP

DRIVE
20:30 -22;30 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN THE HOLE RECEIVE T22:30 - 23:30 1.00 LOG 4 RIGUP WIRELINE TRUCK AND MAKE UP PUMP IN SUB

CONRDENT



USStar E & P Page 2 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Spud Date: 6/1/2003
Location: 17- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2010
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

Date From - To Hours Code e Description of Operations

2/22/2010 23:30 -01:30 2.00 LOG 4 RIH WITH GYRO, LOST COMMUNICATION WITH TOOL, POOH AND
TRPUBLESHOOT GYRO

01:30 -02:30 1.00 LOG 4 RIH WITH GYROAND ACQUIRE TOOL FACE
02:30 -05:00 2.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONALDRILL FROM 4791 TO 4824

05:00 -06:00 1.00 SUR 1 POOH WITH GYRO AND MAKECONNECTION
2/23/2010 06:00 - 08:30 2.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONALDRILL WITH GYROFROM 4824 TO 4857

08:30 -09:30 1.00 LOG 4 POOH WITH GYROAND MAKECONNECTION
09:30 - 11:30 2.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONALDRILL WITH GYRO FROM 4857 TO 4889
11:30 - 12:30 1.00 LOG 4 POOH WITH GYRO AND RIG DOWN WIRELINE TRUCK
12:30 -06:00 17.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONALDRILL FROM 4889 TO 5136 247'

ROP 14.1'lHR WOB 18/22 GPM 255
2/24/2010 06:00 - 14:30 8.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONALDRILL FROM 5136 TO 5236 100'

ROP 11.7'/HR WOB 20/26 GPM 255
14:30 - 15:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE HIGH VIS SWEEP, BUILD AND PUMP TRIP SLUG
15:30 - 18:00 2.50 TRP 12 TRIP OUT OF THE HOLE TO BEND MOTOR TOA 2.23
18:00 - 19:30 1.50 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT BITS, BEND MOTOR TO 2.23, PULL AND INSPECT MWD
19:30 -22:30 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN THE HOLE TO 5206, WASH 30' TO BOTTOM
22:30 -06:00 7.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONALDRILL FROM 5036 TO 5338

2/25/2010 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/5338 T/5670 FEET ENTERED G-1 LIMESTONE @5555
FEET

2/26/2010 06:00 -06:00 24.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/5670 T/ 6095 425' 17.7'lHR
WOB 14/16 RPM 74/118 GPM 255

2/27/2010 06:00 -08:00 2.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/6095 T/5156 61' 30.5'lHR
WOB 15/16 RPM 118 GPM 255

08:00 -09:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP, PUMP HIGH VISSWEEP
09:00 -12:30 3.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR BHA
12:30 -14:00 1.50 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT DIRECTIONAL TOOLSAND MOTOR, ORIENT AND TEST
14:00 - 17:00 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN THE HOLE TO 4679
17:00 - 18:30 1.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICETOP DRIVE ENGINE
18:30 - 19:30 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRC OUT GAS AT THE WINDOW @66 S.P.M. 20 TO 30 FOOT FLARE
19:30 - 21:30 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN THE HOLE TO 6100 FEET &CIRC.OUT TRIP GAS @66 S.P.M. 20 TO

30 FOOT FLARE
21:30 -06:00 8.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 6156 FEET TO 6300 FEET

2/28/2010 06:00 - 11:30 5.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/6300 TI6432 132' 28.4'lHR
WOB 15/16 RPM 123 GPM 256

11:30 - 12:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:00 -22:30 10.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 6432 FT TO 6593
22:30 -23:00 0.50 CIRC 1 PUMP 20 BBL WATER PILL & FOLLOW WITH A HIGH VIS SWEEP & BRINGTO

SURFACE
23:00 -01:00 2.00 TRP 13 TRIP OUT 10 STANDS AND MIX& PUMP A DRY JOB
01:00 -02:30 1.50 TRP 13 TRIP TO THEWINDOW @4756 FEET
02:30 -03:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC AND MIXA E.C.D. PILL OF 11.4 PPG AND SPOT IN THE CASINGWELL

WASFLOWING1"' FLOW
03:00 -06:00 3.00 TRP 13 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR MWD.

3/1/2010 06:00 -07:00 1.00 TRP 13 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR MWD
07:00 -08:00 1.00 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT MWD, CHECK MOTOR AND BIT
08:00 - 11:30 3.50 TRP 13 TRIP IN HOLE TO WINDOW
11:30 -12:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATEECD PILL OUT OF HOLE
12:00 -13:00 1.00 TRP 13 TRIP IN IN HOLE
13:00 - 13:30 0.50 REAM i WASH 30' TO BOTTOM
13:30 - 14:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATETRIP GAS OUT OF HOLE
14:00 -06:00 16.00 DRL 1 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/6593 T/ 6876 FT. 283' 17.6'lHR RECEIVED

CONRDENTIALJUN14 2010
Printed: 6/10/2010 10:22:01 AM

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Spud Date: 6/1/2003
Location 17- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2010
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number 777

Date From - To Hours Code Description of 0perations
3/1/2010 14:00 - 06:00 16.00| DRL 1 WOB 15/16 RPM 123 GPM255
3/2/2010 06:00 - 03:00 2iCO DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/6876 TI 7254 378 18.0'lHR

03:00 -03:30 0.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT 10 STANDS ANDPUMP TRIP SLUG
03:30 - 05:00 1.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT FOR BIT AND PUSH PIPE
05:00 -05:30 0.50 CIRC 1 SPOT11.0 PPG,35 BBL ECD PILL
05:30 -06:00 0.50 TRP 10 TRIP OUT FORBIT AND PUSH PIPE

3/3/2010 06:00 -09:00 3.00 TRP 10 TRIP OUTOF HOLE FOR BIT AND PUSH PIPE
09:00 - 11:00 2.00 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT MOTOR,BIT AND DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.
11:00 - 14:00 3.00 TRP 1 TRIP IN HOLE TO WINDOW
14:00 -15:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE OUT ECD PILL
15:00 - 16:00 1.00 TRP 10 TRIP IN HOLE
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 REAM i WASH 40' TOBOTTOM
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE OUT TRIP GAS OUT
17:00 - 06:00 13.00 DRL 2 DIRECÌlONAL DRILL F/7254 T/7391

3/4/2010 06:00 - 17:30 11.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/7391 T/ 7486
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG 1 RíG SERVICE
18:00 - 22:00 4.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 7486 FEET TO 7526 FEET
22:00 -22:30 0.50 CIRC 1 CIRC.UP SAMPLES
22:30 -06:00 7.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM7526 FEET TO 7675 WI 15,000 BIT WEIGHT 255

G.P.M ON PUMPS@3400 PSI 60 RPM ON TABLE 149' 19.8
3/5/2010 06:00 - 15:30 9.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/7675 Tl7863 188' 19.8'lHR

WOB 16/18 RPM 124 GPM 255
15:30 - 16:30 1.00 TRP 14 SHORT TRIPTO 7233
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
17:00 - 17:30 0.50 TRP 14 TRIP IN THE HOLE
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAM FROM 7743 TO 7863 FEET (120 FEET )
18:00 -06:00 12.00 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 7863 FEET TO 8153 FT. 290' 24.2'lHR (

ROTATE@ 55 RPM BIT WT= 15000 WITH 255 GPM MOTOR SPEED= 74
3/6/2010 06:00 -12:30 6.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL F/8153 T/8310 157' 24.2'/HR

12:30 -14:00 1.50 TRP 14 SHORT TRIPTO 7365 FEET
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 REAM 1 WASH & REAMFROM 8250 TO 8310 FEET = 60 FEET
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE&TOP DRIVE
15:00 -06:00 15.00 DRL 2 DIRECTlöNAL DRILL FROM 8310 TO 8641 FEET 331' 22.0'lHR

WOB 16/18 RPM 124 GPM 255
3/7/2010 06:00 -06:30 0.50 CIRC 1 PUMP FRESHWATERSWEEP AND CIR. BOTTOMS UP

06:30 -08:00 1.50 TRP 14 SHORT TRIP TO /7245' TAGGED UP @8356'
08:00 -09:30 1.50 REAM 1 WASH AND REAM F/8344 T/8641
09:30 -11:30 2.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR CASING. PUMP FRESH WATER

SWEEP AND SPOT POLY BEADS.
11:30 - 14:30 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR CASING
14:30 - 15:00 0.50 CIRC 1 SPOT ECDPILL @WINDOW
15:00 - 18:00 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP OUT OF HOLE FOR CASING
18:00 -20:00 2.00 TRP i LAYDOWN AND LOAD OUT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
20:00 - 20:30 0.50 CSG 1 PREJOB SAFETY MEETINGAND RIG UP CASING CREWS & LAYDOWN

MACHINE
20:30 - 22:30 2.00 CSG 4 RUN 85 JTS OF 4.5" LINNER 52 JTS BLANK N-80 LT&C&33 JTS OF 4110

PERFORATED LINNER LINNER LENGTH = 3741.08 FT
22:30 -23:00 0.50 CSG 1 RIGDOWN CASING CREWS 8: LAY DOWN MACHINE
23:00 -01:30 2.50 TRP 2 TRIP IN THEHOLE WITH THE 4 1/2" LINNER. SET LINNER TOP @4790 FT

SHOE @8532 FEET
01:30 - 02:00 0.50 CSG 1 RIGUP LAYDOWN MACHINE
02:00 - 06:00 4.00 TRP 3 LAYDOWN DRILLPIPE

3/8/2010 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 TRP 3 LAYDOWNDRILLPIPE RECEIVEI)
POWIDFNTIAL JUN14 2OK

41 Printed: 6/10/2010 10:22:01 AM

DIV.0FOlL,GAS&



Questar E & P Page 4 of 4

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Spud Date: 6/1/2003
Location 17- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 3/7/2010
Rig Name: AZTEC Rig Number: 777

Date From - To Hours Code Description ofÒperaÙons
3/8/2010 11:00 - 12:00 1.00 CSG RIG DOWN LAY DOWN TRUCK,RIG UP WIRE LINE TRUCK

12:00 -14:00 2.00 LOG 4 RU IN HOLEWITH GAUGE RING AND JUNK BASKET, RUN RBP AND SET @
4200'

1400 - 20:00 6.00 LOC 7 NIPPLEDOWN BOP AND CLEAN MUD TANKS
RIG RELEASED @20:00 HRS

20:00 -06:00 10.00 RIG DOWN PREPARE FOR TRUCKS

RECEIVED
CONRDENTIAL 2e,

Printed: 6/10/2010 10:22:01 AM

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Questar E & P Page 1 of 3

Operations Summary Report - Compbefra N

Well Name: GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Spud Date: 6/1/2003
Location: 17- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 6/12/2009
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SEREVICE Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

3/11/2010 06:00 -16:00 | 10.00 LOC 4 TIGHT HOLE - WELL COMPLETION IN THE LATERAL

On 3/10/10 MIRU Rocky Mtn WS #3. NUBOP's. Pick up & tally& rabbit in the
hole wl a ret head; i jt of tbg;ball test sub & 2-7/8" tbg to 4180'. Circ hole clean w/
2% KCL water. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will test tbg &attempt to latch onto & pull ret BP @ 4200'.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 11.6# perf liner 8532-4790'
Csg Depth: 8532'

Perfs:
4-1/2" slotted liner from show @8532' to top @4790', 7", 23#, L-80 csg int.

3/12/2010 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 LOC 4 TIGHT HOLE- WELL COMPLETION IN THE LATERAL

On 3/11/10 w/ ret head & tbg & ball test sub in the hole @4150' test 2-7/8" tbg to
3000# & held OK. Bled off & reverse out test ball. RiH & tag RBP @4200' but
could not engage plug. POOH. Lay down test sub & RIH w/ ret head without guide
shoe & latch onto &release RBP @4200'. Pull plug to2300' & SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will POOH w/ plug & tally&rabbit in the hole w/ 2-3/8" & 2-7/8"
tbg.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 11.6# perf liner 8532-4790'
Csg Depth: 8532'

Perfs:
4-1/2" slotted liner from show @8532' to top@4790', 7", 23#, L-80 csg int.

3/16/2010 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 LOC 4 TIGHT HOLE - WELL COMPLETION IN THE LATERAL

On 3/12/10 SITP=03 and SICP=450# with RBP released and on tbg.at2000'. Bled
down well and pump 20 bbl.of 10# brine down thewll. Finish POOH with tbg.and
RBP. Tally and RIH with 122 jts.of 2-3/8" (3797.86') of work-stimg. x-over, 1 jt of
2-7/8" tbg.; float sub and 149 jts.of 2-7/8" tbg.to end of liner at 8532'. Circ.hole
clean with 2% KCL water. SIT thewell until AM of 3/16/10 when the well willbe
acidized in several stages.

Csg Size: 4-1/2" 11.6# perf liner 8532-4790'
Csg Depth: 8532'

Perfs:
4-1/2" slotted liner from show @8532' to top @4790', 7", 23#, L-80 csg int.

3117/2010 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 1 TIGHT HOLE - WELL COMPLETION IN THE LATERAL

On 3/16/10 SITP=0# with float in the string and SICP=720#. MIRU Halliburton acid
crew to acidize the G-1 lateral down 2-3/8" and 2-7/8" tbg.asfollows per stage. AII
acid is 15% HCL with additives and on all stages the acid was spotted to the end of
the tbg.withthe csg.open and thenthe csg.was closed during the acid and flush
bullhead.
Stages:
Zone #1: Tbg.tail at 8525': Pump 7000 gal of acid and displace with 42 bbl.ofwater.
T Max.rate=7.2; Ave=6.5 BPM; Max.psi=3000#; Ave=2750#. Total load=209 bbl.

RECEIVED

DIV,0F01L,GAS&



Questar E & P Page 2 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GHX13HG-17-8-21 Spud Date: 6/1/2003
Location: 17- 8-S 21-1¯ 26 Rig Release: 6/12/2009
Rig Name: BASIN WELL SEREVICE Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code Description ofOperations

3/17/2010 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 1 Zone #2: With tbg.tailat 7903'. Pump 7000 gal.of acid arid displace with 39 bbl.of
water. Total load of 206 bbl..Max.rate=7;Ave=7 BPM; Max.psi=2750#; Ave=2500#

Zone #3: Withtbg.tailat 7495'. Pump 6000 gal.of acid and displace with 36 bbt.of
water. Total load of 179 bbt.Max.rate=7; Ave=6.7 BPM;Max.psi=2800#;
Ave=2800#".
Zone #4: With tbg.tailat 6928'; Pump 6000 gal.of acid and displace with 33 bbl.of
water. Total load of 176 bbi..Max.rate=7: Ave=6.8 BPM;Max.psi=2500#;
Ave=2375#.
Zone #5: Withtbg.tailat 6493'. Pump 5000 gal.of acid adn displace with 31 bbl.of
water. Total load of 150 bbl..Max.rate=6.7; Ave=6.7 BPM;Max.psi=2350#;
Ave=2000#.
2one #6: With tbg.tailat 5828'. Pump 4000 gal.of acid and displace with 27 bbi of
water. Total load ofí02 bbl. Max. rate=6.6; Ave=6.4 BPM; Max.psi=2525#;
Ave=2375#.
On 3/17/10 will bleed offwell and POOH with tbg.andlay down the 2-3/8"work
string.

Csg Size; 4-1/2" 11.6# perf liner 8532-4790'
Csg Depth: 8532'

Perfs:
4-1/2" slotted liner from show @8532' to top @4790', 7", 23#, L-80 csg int.

Load fromyesterday; 150 csg.vol.
Plus water today:1025
LLTR: 1175

3/22/2010 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 On 3/18/10 SITP=200# and SICP=540#. Bled off well Pull on whipstock and it is
free after leaving 25M# pull on the string overnight. POOH with whipstock and lay
down whipstockand tools. RIH with ret.head and latch onto and release RBP at
4800'. Pullplug to 4150' and SIFN. Used a total of 110 bbl.of brine todayto control
well.

On 3/19/10 SITP and SlCP=200#. Bled down well. Pump 80 bbl.of brine water.
Finish POOH with tbg.andRBP. RIH with production stringas follows: Barred NC;
12 jts.of tbg.,SN; 7" B-2 anchor catcher and 150 jts.of tbg.to surface. ND BOP's
and set anchor with 15M# tension. NUWH. SIFW. On 3/22/10 willrun rods and
pump and RD Rocky Mtn.WS.

Tbg.Datail: (3/19/10): Barred NC=0.44'; 12jts.of tbg. #378.43'; SN=1.10'; B-2
anchor catcher=2.33'; 150 jts.of tbg.=4732.22';Tension=1.0'; KB=14', Tbg.tail at
5129.52'; SN at 4750.56'; A/C at 4749.55'. Alltbg.is used 2-7/8" EUE8rd 6.5#
J-55.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 11.6# perf.liner 8532-4790'
Casing depth: 8532'

Load from yesterday: 1250
Minus daily recovery: 120
Plus water today: 190
LLTR: 1290

RECEIVED
CONEDENTIAL

Printed: 1 / 10 10:2Ž:

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Questar E & P Page 3 of 3

Operations Summary Report

Well Name: GHX 13HG-17-8-21 Spud Date: 6/1/2003
Location: 17- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 6/12/2009
Rig Name: BASINWELL SEREVICE Rig Number: 3

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

3/22/2010 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 Perfs:
4-1/2" slotted liner from shoe at 8532' to topat 4790'
7" 23# L-80 csg.int.

3/23/2010 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 HOT 1 On 3/22/10 SITP and SICP=400#. RU hot oilerand pump 70 bbl.of hot snake oil
down the tbg..Bucket test new pump--OK. RIH with pump and rods as below. Seat
pump and pressure test pump and tbg.to600#and held OK. Hang offwell with
clamp and RDMORocky Mtn. WS. Final report of well completion

Tbg.Detail: (3/19/10):Barred NC=0.44';12 jts.of tbg =378.43'; SN=1.10'; 7" B-2
anchor catcher=2.33'; 150 jts.of tbg.=4732.22'; Tensión=1.0' KB=14. Tbg tail at
5129.52; SN at 4750.65'; A/Cat 4749,55'. AIItbg.isused 2-7/8" EUE 84rd 8.5#
J-55.

Rod and pump detail: (3/22/10): Pump=2-1/2 x 1-3/4" x 20 x 21 x 22 RHAC
(Weatherford #2575); 10-new 3/4" guided rods; 97.3/4; plain rods "D"; 81-7/8" plain
"D" rods, 1-6' x 7/8" pony rod and 1-1/2" x26' polish rod.

Load from yesterday: 1250
Minus daily recovery: 120
Plus water today:190
LLTR: 1290

Perfs:
4-1/2"slotted liner from
shoe at 8532' to top at 4790'
7"23# L-80 csg.int.

Casing size: 4-1/2" 11.6# perf.liner 8532-4790'
Depth: 8532'

RECEIVED
AUNi 4 00

Printed: 6/10/2010 10:22:18 AM

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit: GYPSUM HILLS (GRRV)
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Energy (Gypsum Hills GRRV) FORM A.xls



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL,GAS AND MINING S. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER
See attached

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEÖR TRIBENAME:SUNDRY NOTICESAND REPORTS ON WELLS See attached
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° See attacheddrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL O OTHER 8 WEeLLNAM nd NUMBER:

2 NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:Questar Exploration and Production Company $Û $ Attached
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver s,,,, CO z;, 80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: See attached COUNTY: Attached

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE.MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICEOF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILY ABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENTOR FLARE
O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BACK WATERDISPOSAL(Submit Original Fonn Only)

O CHANGEWELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-ÒFFDate of work completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETEDOPERATIONS. Cleady show all pertinent details including dates,depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This namechange involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The same
employees willcontinue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. AIIoperations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965666683
Fee Land Bond Number:
BIA Bond Number: 799446- O/O{p f3
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As of
June 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligations as operator of the properties as described onthe list

NAME(PLEASE P NT) Morgan Anderson
TITLE Regulatory AffairsAnalyst

SIGNATURS DATE 6/23/2010

(This space for State use only)

RECEIVED APPROVED /g/ Mô9
JUN2 8 2010

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
ÛÎVÎSÎOn of Oil,OasandMiningDIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING EarleneRussell,Engineering



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
GYPSUMHILLS (GRRV)

effectiveJune 14,2010

well_name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
leaseGH 4 19 080S 210E 4304730028 5355 Federal OW PG'JI1-19 19 080S 210E 4304731065 5355 Federed ONV P(1823-21 21 080S 210E 4304731541 5355 Federal ()?V PGH 4-21 21 080S 210E 4304731826 5355 Federal OW PGH 5-21 21 080S 210E 4304731827 5355 Federal OW PGH 9 20 080S 210E 4304732304 5355 Federal OW DRL CGH 11 20 080S 210E 4304732459 5355 Federal OW PGH 13 21 080S 210E 4304732460 5355 Federal OW PGH 14 20 080S 210E 4304732647 5355 Federal OW P601 18 20 080S 210E 4304732650 5355 Federal ()VV PGH 19 20 080S 210E 4304732651 5355 Federal OW PGH 20 20 080S 210E 4304732652 5355 Federal OW PGH 16 20 080S 210E 4304732675 5355 Federal OW PGH 10W-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304733528 12736 Federal GW P601 10Gr-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304733566 5355 Federed CAV PWV 11W-17-8-21 17 080S _210E 4304733912 13228 Federal GW PTV3759V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304733954 13332 Federal (39V PTV3779V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304733956 13330 Federal GVV PGE[9NV-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734150 13392 Federal (19V PGH 16W-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734156 13354 Federal GW PTV\lK10TV-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734561 13744 Federal GNV PCURJ(159V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734562 13674 Federal (19V PGHX 13HG-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734723 5355 Federal OW P

GH 1G-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734927 5355 Federal OW PAN'l>E2\V-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734928 14253 Federal (ITV PWVX 8W-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304"l34929 13792 Federal GW PCdš4hfD-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304735068 14213 Federal (ITV P
GH 13MU-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304735070 14817 Federal GW PIGH5tv-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304735097 14557 Federal (IRT PWVX 3MU-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304735318 14113 Federal GW P(IH 15híL-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304735323 15483 Iù>deral (INV PGli lhdL-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304735324 14824 Federed (IMF PWVX 14MU 17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304735369 14098 Federal GW PTV37)C1210RJ-17-8-21 17 080S 2101E 4304735370 15108 Federal CITV PWVX 8MU-19-8-21 19 080S 210E 4304735372 14241 Federal GW PGH 10ML-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304735391 15482 Federal GW PGH 8G-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304737992 5355 Federal OW PGlã16G-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304737993 5355 Feder<d O3V PGH 8G-18-8-21 18 080S 210E 4304738661 Federal GW APD CGH 6-20-8-21 20 080S 210E 4304738662 17041 Federal (GW P

Bonds:BLhn = ESBOOOO24
BIA=956010693

State = 965010695 1 of



STATEOF UTAH AMENDEDREPORTS FORM 8
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES (Nghftghtchanges)

DIVISIONOF OIL,GASANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBElt

UB8219
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBENAME

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLET10N REPORT AND LOG UTETRIBE
la TYPEOFWELL OIL MS DRY OTHER

7. UNITorCAAGREEMENTNAME
WELL WELL GYPSUM HILLS

b TYPEOFWORK ß. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:

NWKO IW O PO "E RY OTHER GHX13HG 17-8-21
2 NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. APINUMBER'

Questar Exploration& Production Company 4304734723
3. ADDRESSOFOPERATOR: PHQNENUMBER' 10FIELDANDPOOL,ORWILDCAT

11002 E 17500 S Vemal UT 84078 (435) 781-4342 GYPSUM HILLS

4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11 T T SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE,

ArsuarAce 675' FSL 661' FWL SWSW i7 SS 21E
Kr TCP PRODUCING INTERVALREPORTED BELow $75' FSL 661' FWL

9. ÑAL Ø 5/• 2 couar n smva
ATTOTALDEPTH. 44' NL,990' FEL, S , Sec 19-TSS-R21Ei UINTAH UTAH

14. DNTE SPUDDED: 15 DKTET D.REACHED 16 DATE COMPLETED 17 ELEVATIONS(DF, RKB, RT, GL):

4/9/2003 3/6/2010 3/23/2010 ABANDONED READYTOPRODUCE

18. TOTAL DEPTH: MD 8 641 19. PLUG BACKT.D.: MD 532 20. IF MULTlPLECOMPLETIONS,How MANY 21. D BSR E MD

avo 5.283 Tvo $4Ÿ$ Two

22. TYPE ELECTRICANDOTHER MECHANICALLOGS RUN (Submitcopyofeach)
WEU. CORED? NO YES (Subm )

No current logs have been run on thishorizontal lateral #2 DSTRUN? No YES (S mUepo

DIRECTIONALSURVEYT NO YES (Submitcopy)

24. CASING AND LINER RECORD (Report allsbings setin Well)

HOLE SIZE SIZEIGRADE WEIGHT (filL) TOP (MD) BOTTOM (MD) STAGE EMENTER C
O SA VO L)

CEMENT TOP " AMOUNT PULLED

6.125 4.5 p110 11.6 5,601 8,532

6.125 4.5 nSO 11.6 5,601 8,532

26. TUBING RECORD

SIZE DEPTHSET(MD) PACKERSET(MD) SIZE DEPTHSET(MD) PACKERSET(MD) SI2E DEPTHSET(MD) PACKERSET(MD)

2.875 5,130
21L PRODUCINGINTERVAI.S 27. PERFORA110N AECORD

FORMATIONNAME TOP(MD) BOTTOM(MD) TOP(TVD) BOTTOM(TVD) INTERVAL(ToptBot-MD) SizE NO HOLES PERFORATIONSTATUS

(^1 Gm Rvr G-1 Lime 4,778 4,784 4,790 8,532 4.5 orma Squeezed O
(8)

Open Squeezed

(C)
Open Squeezed

(D)
Open Squeezed

26. ACID, FRAC11)RE, THEATMENT, CEMENT SOUEEEE. ETC.

DEPTH INTERVAL AMOUNTAND TYPE OF MATERIAL

5828' - 8525' Pumped 35,000 gals of 15% HCLacid

2!L ENCLOBEDATTACHMENTS:
30.WELLSTATUS:

O ELECTRIC UMECHANGU.OGS GEOLOGICREPORT DSTREPORT DIRECTIONALSURVEY pfOducing
O SUNDRY NOTICE FOR PLUGGING AND CEMENT VERIFICATION CORE ANALYS$ OTHE

DECOVED
(fil2000) JUN1 6 2010 (CONTINUEDONBACK)

DNOF01LGAS&



31. INITIALPRODUCTION INTERVALA (As shown in ihm 828)

DATEEIRSTPRODUCED: TESTDATE RSTESTED: TESTPRODUCT10N OlL-BBL GAS-MCF: WATER-BBL: PROD.METHOD:

3/22/2010 3/24/2010 24 RATE* * 267 0 174 pumping
CHOKESEE: TBG.PRESS. CSG.PRESS APlGRAVITY -GAS GASIDILRATIO 24HRPRODUCT10N OIL-BBC GAS-MCF: WATER-BBL INTERVALSTATUS

250 40 REFES: -•

1NTERVALB (As shown in item f25)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE OURSTESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OlL - BBC GAS - MCF: WATER - BEL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES -•

CHOKESEE: TBG.PRESS. CSG PRESS APIGRAVITY -GAS GASOILRATIO24HRPRODUCTION OIL-BBL GAS-MCF: WATER-BBL INTERVALSTATUS
RATES: -

INTERVAL C (As shown in item $26)

DATEFIRST PRODUCED: TEST DATE HOURSTESTED: TEST PRODUCTION OIL- BBC GAS - MCF: WATER - BBL: PROD. METHOD:
RATES: -•

CHOKESEE TBG,PRESS. CSG PRESK APIGRAVITY BTU-GAS GASCILRATIO24HRPRODUCTION OIL-BBL GAS-MCF: WATER-BBL: INTERVALSTATUS
RATES: -+

INTERVALD (As shown in item $26)

DATEFIRSTPRODUCED TEST DATE HOURSTESTED PRODUCTION OIL-BBL GAS-MCF: WATER-BBL: ROD METHOD:
S: -•

CHOKESŒE TBG.PRESS. CSG.PRESS APIGRAVITY BTU-GAS GASCILRATIO HRPRODUCTIONOlL-BBL GAS-MCF: WATER-BBL: NTERVALSTATUS
TES:

32. DISPOSITION OF GAS (Sold,Used for Fuel, Vented, Etc.)

Sold
33. SUMMARYOF POROUSZONES (include As¡ulfers): 34. FORMATION (l.og) MARKERS

Show allimportant zones ofporosity and contents themot Coted Intervals andalldrill-stem tests, including dop10 interval
tested;cushionused. lima toolopen;11awingandshut in pressuresandrecoveries.

Fonnation Descdpnans,Contents. etc. Name

35. ADDmONAL REMARIO (Include plugg .ig
procedure)

#27: Perforated Lineraltemating jts of blank & perforated fl 560t-8532. *#4 Amended new south lateral on BHL.

38. I hereby certifythat tfloforegoing and sttached infonnation is compleheand corisot as determinedfrom all avallablerecords.

NAME Dahn Caldgell vm.E Office Administrator

SIGNATURE DATE 6/16/2010

Illis report mustbe submittedwithin30 days of
e completingorplugging a new well • reentering a previouslyplugged and abandoned well
• drillinghorizontal laterals from an existing well bore • significantlydeepening an existingwell bore below the previous bottom-hole depth
e recompleting to a different producing formation • drillinghydocarbon exploratoryholes, such as core samplesand stratigraphic tests

* ITEM20: Showthe number of completions ifproduction is measuredsepâratelyfrom twoor more formations.

** ITEM24:CementTop-Showhowreportedtop(s) of tement were determined (cîrculated (CIR),calculated (CAL),cement bond log (CBL),temperaturesurvey (TS})

Send to: Utah Divisionof Oil,Gas and Mining Phone: 801-538-5340
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801 Fæc 801-359,3940
Salt Lake City. Utah 84114-5801



Page 1 of 1

Carol Daniels - GHX 13HG 17-8-21 Amended WCR

From: Dahn Caldwell
To: Carol Daniels , Earlene Russell
Date: 6/16/2010 2:43 PM
Subject: GHX 13HG 17-8-21 Amended WCR
Attachments:

This is the GHX13HG 17-8-21 Amended WCR. Iamended Item #4 - BHLLateral.

Sorry about the confusion.

.'Dann€afdwet£
QEP Energy Company
(435)781-4342 - Office
(435)781-4329 - Fax

RECElVED
JUN182010

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

file://C:\Documents and Settings\OGMUSER\Local Settings\Temp\XPgrpwise\4C18E323...



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
*pCH se Utah State Office og ERICA

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL 2 8 2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

l FieldhOffice PriaceFie ce Mo Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Fastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS
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