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Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) ,-, .-.,

OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR pp Î i 2ÛÛ1 5. Lease Serial No.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
~~ UTU-78433

APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName

N/A

la. Type of Work: DRILL REENTER
7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.

b, Type of Well: 00 Well Gas Well Other Single Zone Multiple Zone Federal 11-21-9-19

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.
Pannonian Energy, Inc.

3A. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

14 Inverness Dr. E., Englewood, CO 80112 (303) 483-0044 Riverbend
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Bik, and Survey or Area

At surface 577' FNL & 522' FWL (NWNW)
At proposedprod. Zone Section 21-T9S-R19E
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately 25.8 miles from Myton, Utah Uintah | UT
15. Distance fiom proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well

location to nearest
property or lease line, ft 522'
(Also to nearest drig. unit line, ifany) 996.37 40

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, dnlling, completed, See Map
applied for, on this lease, ft 12,500 Utah BLM Bond No. 4127759

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4763' GL Upon Approval 35 days

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

I. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized office.

25. Signature Name (Printed/Typed)Howard
Sharpe

Date

Title /
Vice President

App Sgnatur Name(Printed/Typed) De

Tide si eldMana ,office

Mneral Resour
Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct

operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 100Iand Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.
*(InstructionNro?EOF^PER°Y^' CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTACHED

RECEivED
DECi 8 2001
DIVISION

O
Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) ,-, .-.,

OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR pp Î i 2ÛÛ1 5. Lease Serial No.

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
~~ UTU-78433

APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER 6. IfIndian,AllotteeorTribeName

N/A

la. Type of Work: DRILL REENTER
7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.

b, Type of Well: 00 Well Gas Well Other Single Zone Multiple Zone Federal 11-21-9-19

2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

Pannonian Energy, Inc.
3A. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

14 Inverness Dr. E., Englewood, CO 80112 (303) 483-0044 Riverbend
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Bik, and Survey or Area

At surface 577' FNL & 522' FWL (NWNW)
At proposedprod. Zone Section 21-T9S-R19E
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately 25.8 miles from Myton, Utah Uintah | UT
15. Distance fiom proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well

location to nearest
property or lease line, ft 522'
(Also to nearest drig. unit line, ifany) 996.37 40

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, dnlling, completed, See Map
applied for, on this lease, ft 12,500 Utah BLM Bond No. 4127759

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4763' GL Upon Approval 35 days

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

I. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized office.

25. Signature Name (Printed/Typed)Howard
Sharpe

Date

Title /
Vice President

App Sgnatur Name(Printed/Typed) De

Tide si eldMana ,office

Mneral Resour
Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct

operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 100Iand Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.
*(InstructionNro?EOF^PER°Y^' CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTACHED

RECEivED
DECi 8 2001
DIVISION



O g
COAs Page 1 of __6

Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: Pannonian Energy, Inc.

Well Name & Number: Federal 11-21-9-19

API Number:

Lease Number: U-78443

Location: NWNW Sec. _2_1 T.9S_R. 19E

Agreement: N/A

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval
for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well

is being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

1. DRILLING PROGRAM

1. Estimated Depth at Which Oil, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearing Zones are Expected
to be Encountered

Report ALL water shows and water-bearing sands to John Mayers of this office prior to setting

the next casing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies of State of Utah form
OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected, submit samples to this office

along with any water analyses conducted.

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLM at onsite)
encountered during drilling, will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas
shows will be tested to determine commercial
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

2. Pressure Control Equipment

Chart recorders shall be used for all pressure tests.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while drilling
and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

3. Casing Program and Auxiliary Equipment

In addition to the cementing proposal for the surface casing, Class G neat cement shall be placed
within the surface casing-conductor annulus from the surface down to a minimum of 200'

4. Mud Program and Circulating Medium

None

5. Coring, Logging and Testing Program

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to this office on a weekly
basis.

To evaluate cement quality across the usable water zone, a Cement Bond Log will be required
from the surface casing shoe to the base of the conductor pipe.

6. Notifications of Operations

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior approval
of the AO. If operations are to be suspended, prior approval of the AO will be obtained and
notification given before resumption of operations.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "SundryNotice" (Form 3160-

5) to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved
plan are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.

The date on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for oil wells as the
date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporary storage facility,
such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or, the date on which
liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent storage facility, whichever first occurs;
and, for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped
from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be
generated or, the date on which gas is first measured through permanent metering facilities,
whichever first occurs.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will be notified when the well

is placed in a producing status. Written notification of such must be submitted to this office not
later than five (5) days following the date on which the well is placed on
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

Gas produced from this well may not be vented or flared beyond an initial authorized test period
of 30 days or 50 MMCF following its completion, whichever occurs first, without the prior
written approval of the Authorized Officer. Should gas be vented or flared without approval
beyond the authorized test period, the operator may be directed to shut-in the well until the gas
can be captured or approval to continue venting or flaring as uneconomic is granted and the
operator shall be required to compensate the lessor for that portion of the gas vented or flared
without approval which is determined to have been avoidably lost.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5(d) shall be submitted to the
appropriate Field Office within 60 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs first.
All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be adhered to.
All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively sealed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (1).

No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior approval of the AO. In
the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergency situations, oral approval will be
obtained from the AO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be filed with
the AO within thirty (30) days following completion of the well for abandonment. This report
will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Final
abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by the approved
APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his
representative, or the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.

7. Other Information

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on lease or off-lease will have
prior written approval from the AO.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location. The oil and gas
meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries and tested for meter accuracy at least
quarterly thereafter. The AO will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will
be submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform to
Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 5 for
natural gas measurement.

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982, as implemented
by the applicable provisions of the operating regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-l(c), requires

that "not later than the 5th business day after any well begins production on which royalty is due
anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site, or resumes production in the case of a well
which has been off production for more than 90 days, the operator shall notify the authorized
officer by letter or sundry notice, Form 3160-5, or orally to be followed by a letter or sundry

notice, of the date on which such production has begun or
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

If you fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time allowed, you shall be liable
for a civil penalty of up to $10,000per violation for each day such violation continues, not to
exceed a maximum of 20 days. See Section 109(c)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty
Management Act of 1982 and the implementing regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-l(b)(5)(ii).

APD approval is valid for a period of one (1) year from the signature date. An extension period
may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Ed Forsman (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435)
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPT EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, they are not necessarily hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids

Gas plant cooling tower cleaning wastes

Painting wastes

Oil and gas service company wastes, such as empty drums, drum rinsate, vacuum truck rinsate,

sandblast media, painting wastes, spend solvents, spilled chemicals, and waste acids

Vacuum truck and drum rinsate from trucks and drums, transporting or containing nonexempt

waste

Refinery wastes

Liquid and solid wastes generated by crude oil and tank bottom reclaimers

Used equipment lubrication oils

Waste compressor oil, filters, and blowdown

Used hydraulic fluids

Waste solvents

Waste in transportation pipeline-related pits

Caustic or acid cleaners

Boiler cleaning wastes

Boiler refractory bricks

Incinerator ash

Laboratory wastes

Sanitary wastes

Pesticide wastes

Radioactive tracer wastes

Drums, insulation and miscellaneous
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

SURFACE USE PROGRAM

Conditions of Approval (COA)

Pannonian Energy, Inc. - Well No.s l1-21-9-19 & 22-22-9-19

Location and Type of Water Supply:

Your permit to drill identified that the Dalbo Ouray Water facility would be used as the water
supply for drilling. If any other water source is necessary it will require additional approval by
the authorized officer of the Vernal Field Office.

Source of Construction Materials:

Only subsurface soils will be used for construction. All top soils will be stockpiled and identified
in the APD for future reclamation of disturbed areas.

Plans For Reclamation of Location:

All seeding for reclamation operations at this location shall use the following seed mixture:

Gardners saltbush Atriplex gardneri 3 lbs/acre
shadscale Atriplex confertifolia 3 lbs/acre
Indain rice grass Oryzopsis hymenoides 2 lbs/acre
galleta grass Hilaria jamesii 4 lbs/acre

If the seed mixture is to be aerially broadcasted, the pounds per acre shall be doubled. All seed
poundages are in Pure Live Seed.

Immediately after construction the stockpiled top soil will be seeded and the seed worked into
the soil by "walking" the pile with caterpillar
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DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5, Lease Serial No.
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W3n-le y W.aus y

At proposedprod.Zone (20.406 7 K - /aq, 79233 Section 21-T9S-R19E
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately 25.8 miles from Myton, Utah Uintah UT
15. Distance tiomproposed 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well

location to nearest
property or lease line, it. 522'
(Also lo nearest drig. unit line, ifany) 996.37 40

18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
to nearest well, dallmg, completed, See Map
applied for, on this lease, ft 12,500 Utah BLM Bond No. 4127759

2 I. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4763' GL Upon Approval 35 days

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No, 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file(see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (ifthe location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Omce. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized office.

25. Signature Name (Printed/Typed) Date

Howard Sharpe
Title

Vice President
Ap (Signa , Name (Printed/Typed) Date

ia/j zal
Tft e Sistant ield Ma ,omce

/

MineralResour i
Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicantto conduct

operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 12l2, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
*(lnstructionso eCTiCEOFAPPROVg,,dQNGITINSOFAPP VALÀTTACHEC

ga Utah Division CEIVED

DI
SIO7N

O
- OfL,GAS AND



PANNONIAN ENERGY, INC. *

T9S Ri9E SL B.&M* * • • • Well location, FEDERAL #11-21-9-19, located
,

os shown in the NW 1/4 NW 1/4 of SectionÎ¤Î2 liçA EAST - GL.O. (Bosis of Bearings) Â'$r" 21, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah.Pite or s es 2651.34' - (Measured) Pile of Stones

BASIS OF ELEVATION

SPOT ELEVATIONAT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF SECTION
21, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE UTELAND BUTTE

522 FEDERAL/11-21-9-19 QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(Comp ) , (TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATESElev. Ungraded Ground =- 476] DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID

ELEVATION IS MARKEDAS BEING 4749 FEET.

e

oo oo - o

SCALE

CERTIFICATE
-----

- THIS IS TO CERTlFY THAT THE ABOVE PLAT WAS PREPARED FROM
FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL SURVEYS MADE giggy DER MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME AR A T TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND BELIE

LOT 2 LOT 1

83 REVISED: 11-19-01 D.COX sgTE OF UT

EAST - 42.50 (G.L.O.) UINTAH ENGINEERING b+ G
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VËNMg! H 84078

(435) 789-1017
SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:LEGEND: 1" = 1000' 6-2-01 6-11-01
PARTY REFERENCES

=
90° SYMBOL D.A. P.M. D.COX G.L.O. PLAT

= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE = 40'01'19" WEATHER FILE
A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED. LONGITUDE = 109'47'32" WARM PANNONIAN ENERGY,
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PANNONIAN ENERGY, INC.

Federal 11-21-9-19
NWNW, Section 21-T9S-R19E

Uintah County, Utah
Lease No. UTU-78433

DRILLING PLAN

1. ESTIMATED TOPS OF IMPORTANT GEOLOGIc MARKERS & ANTICIPATED WATER, OIL, GAS
OR MINERAL EORMATIONS:

Depth Hydrocarbon/Water
Formation it) Bearing Zones

Uintah Surface

Green River 1,933' Gas/Oil

Wasatch 5,483' Gas

Mesa Verde 8,800' Gas

TD 12,500'

All usable (<10,000ppm TDS) water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by
BLM at onsite) encountered during drilling will be recorded by depth and adequately
protected. Allsignificant oil and gas shows will be tested to determine commercial potential.
This information shall be reported to the Vernal BLMOffice.

2. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT:

Allwell control equipment shall be in accordance with Onshore Order #2 for 5M systems.

The minimum specifications for pressure control equipment that will be provided are included
on the attached schematic diagram showing size, pressure ratings, testing procedures, and
testing frequency.

5000# BOP With 4-1/2" Pipe Rams
5000# BOP With Blind Rams
5000# Annular

Auxiliary equipment to be used:

• Upper kelly cocks with handle available.

The manifold includes appropriate valves and adjustable chokes. The kill line will have one
check valve. Ram type preventers will be pressure tested to full working pressure (utilizing a
test plug)
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• initial installation;
• whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken;
• following related repairs;
• at 30 day intervals

The annular preventer will be pressure tested to 50 percent of the rated working pressure.
Allpressure tests shall be maintained at least ten minutes or until provisions of test are met,
whichever is longer.

Annular preventers shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip.

A BOPE pit level drill will be conducted weekly for each drilling crew.

All tests and drills will be recorded in the drilling log.

The accumulator will have sufficient capacity to open the HCR valve, close all rams plus the
annular preventer, and retain 200 psi above pre-charge pressure without the use of closing
unit pumps. The system will have two independent power sources to close the preventers in
accordance with 5M system requirements outlined in Onshore Order #2.

Remote controls shall be readily accessible to the driller. Master controls shall be at the
accumulator.

3. CASING & CEMENTING PROGRAM:

A. The proposed casing program willbe as follows:

Hole
Depth Size Size Grade Weight Thread Condition
0-220' 17 ½" 13 3/8" H-40 48#lft ST&C New

0-3,500 12-1/4" 9-5/8" J-55 40#lft LT&C New
0-TD 7-7/8" 4-1/2" P-110 13.5#/ft LT&C New

The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved to protect
and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones, lost circulation zones,
abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively valuable deposits of minerals. Any
isolating medium other than cement shall receive approval prior to use. The casing setting
depth shall be calculated to position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which
will contain the maximum pressure to which it will be exposed during normal drilling
operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all relevant factors,
including: presencelabsence of hydrocarbons, fracture gradients, usable water zones,
formation pressures, lost circulation zones, other minerals, or other unusual characteristics.

All casing, except conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and tested. Used casing
shall meet or exceed API standards for new
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The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary cement job
or by remedial cementing. Ifdrive pipe is used, it may be left in place if its totallength is less
than twenty feet below the surface. If the total length of the drive pipe is equal to or greater
than twenty feet, it will be pulled prior to cementing surface casing, or itwillbe cemented in
place.

Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement fluid. A bottom
plug or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush fluid, inner string cement
method, etc., shall be utilized to help isolate the cement from contamination by the mud
being displaced ahead of the cement slurry.

All casing strings below the conductor shall be pressure tested to 0.22 psi per foot of casing
string length or to 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed 70% of the minimum
internal yield. Ifpressure declines more than 10% in 30 minutes, corrective action shall be
taken.

The bottom three joints of the surface casing willhave one centralizer per joint and one
centralizer every fourth joint thereafter.

Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.

B. The proposed cementing program willbe as follows:

Conductor String: Cement will be circulated to surface. Estimated volume (100%
over theoretical value) 260 sxs Class "G", 3% CaCl2 w/0.25 #/sx
Flocele @ 15.6 ppg, 1.19 ft3

Surface String: Cement will be circulated to surface. Estimated volume (35%
over theoretical value):

Lead: 465 sx Hifill@12.0 ppg, 2.87 ft3/SX.

Tail: 380 sx Class "G" 2% CaCl2 @ 15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft'Isx.

Production String: Estimated volume (gaugehole + 15%):

Lead: 450 sx Hifill@11.0 ppg, 3.84 ft Isx.
Tail: 1790 sx 50/50 POZ @ 14.35 ppg, 1.26 ft3

Actual volumes will be calculated and adjusted with caliper log prior to cementing. Ten
percent excess will be pumped.

For surface casing, waiting on cement timewillbe adequate to achieve 500 psi compressive
strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

Anticipated cement tops willbe reported as to depth, not the expected number of sacks of
cement to be used. The Vernal District BLMOffice willbe notified, with sufficient lead time,
in order to have a BLM representative on location while running all casing strings and
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After cementing the surface pipe and/or any intermediate strings, but before commencing
any test, the casing string shall stand cemented untilthe cement has reached a compressive
strength of at least 500 psi at the shoe. WOC timeshall be recorded in the Driller's Log.

4. DRILLING FLUIDS PROGRAM:

Weight Water
Iríterval Type (ppý) Visbosity pH Los emarks
0-400' Spud 8.4 -9.0 30-45+ 8.0 NC Gel & lime as

required.
400'-Top of Wtr/gel 8.4-8.8 27-35 8.5-9.0 NC Min. Wt.

Wasatch
Top of KCL 8.5- 35-45 9.0-11.0 10-15cc * Min Wt. to control

Wasatch-TD Mud
11.2*

@TD formation pressure.

NC = no control

Sufficient quantities of mud material will be maintained on site or be readily accessible for
the purpose of assuring well control. SPR will be recorded on daily drilling report after
mudding up. Visual mud monitoring will be conducted during operations.

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and/or Indian lands without
prior BLM approval to ensure adequate protection of fresh water aquifers.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title lil in an amount equal to or greater than
10,00_0 pounds willbe used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in
association with the drilling, testing, or completing of this well. Furthermore, no extremely
hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, will be
used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling, testing, or
completing of thiswell.

5. EVALUATIONPROGRAM:

Logs: DLLT/GR: TD to base surface casing
SDL/DSN/GRICAL: TD to 300' above Green River
MRIL: TD to 100' above Wasatch

(at operators discretion)

Cores: None anticipated.

DST's: None anticipated.

When cement has not been circulated to surface, the cement top will be determined by
either a temperature survey or cement bond log. Should a temperature survey fail to locate
the cement top, a cement bond log will be run. A field copy will be submitted to the Vernal
BLM office.

Drillstem tests, if they are run, will adhere to the following
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Initial opening of the drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours unless
specific approval to start during other hours is obtained from the Authorized Officer.
However, DST's may be allowed to continue at night if the test was initiated during
daylight hours and the rate of flow is stabilized and ifadequate lighting is available (i.e.,
lighting which is adequate for visibilityand vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can
be released, but trippingshall not begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained
from the Authorized Officer. Closed chamber DST's may be performed day or night.

Some means of reverse circulation shall be provided in case of flow to the surface
showing evidence of hydrocarbons.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly installed
before a test starts.

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to be operational during
the test shall have spark arresters or water-cooled exhausts.

6. ABNORMAL ÛONDITIONS:

No anticipated abnormal pressures or temperatures are expected to be encountered. No
hydrogen sulfide is expected.

Anticipated Maximum bottom-hole pressure is 6825 psi.

7. OTHER INFORMATION:

The anticipated starting date and duration of the operation will be as follows:

Starting Date: Upon Approval
Duration: 35 Drilling Days & 20 Completion Days

lf the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, Well Completion or Recompletion
Report and Log (Form 3160-4) willbe submitted within 30 days after completion of the well
or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3160. Copies
of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well test data, geologic summaries, sample
descriptions, daily drilling reports, daily completion reports, and all other surveys or data
obtained and compiled during the drilling, completion, and/or workover operations, willbe
submitted directly to the Authorized Officer or filed with Form 3160-4.

The use of materials under BLMjurisdictionwillconform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

Deviations from the proposed drilling and/or workover program willbe approved by the
Authorized Officer. Safe drilling and operating practices will be observed. Allwells, whether
drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, willbe identified in accordance with 43 CFR
3162.

"Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (form 3160-5) will be filed for approval for all changes
of plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR
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AIIlease and/or unit operations willbe conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Orders No. 1 and No.
2, and the approved Plan of Operations. The Operator is fullyresponsible for the actions of its
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnishedto the field representative to ensure
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PANNONIAN ENERGY, INC.

Federal 11-21-9-19
NWNW, Section 21-T9S-R19E

Uintah County, Utah
Lease No. UTU-78433

SURFACE USE PLAN

An onsite inspection for the subject well was conducted on June 26, 2001. Weather conditions at
the time of the onsite inspection were overcast and windy. In attendance were the following
individuals:

Stan Olmstead - Bureau of Land Management
Robert Kay - Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying
Robin Dean - Pannonian Energy, Inc.
Kelly Olds - Halliburton Integrated Solutions
Sheila Bremer - Halliburton Integrated Solutions

1. EXISTING RoAos:

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of existing access roads.

See Topo Map A for directions to the proposed location from Myton, Utah.

The existing roads will be maintained and kept in good repair.

2. ACCEss RoAos TO BE CONSTRUCTED:

Approximately 0.5 miles of an 2-track and 0.6 miles of a reclaimed road will be required to
access the proposed location.

The proposed access road was centerline staked.

The new road will be completed as a single lane 18-foot subgrade road with no CMPs (see
Topo Map B).

Maximum grade will be less than eight percent.

There are no major cuts or fills, turnouts, or bridges anticipated along the proposed access
route.

No gates, cattleguards, fence cuts, or modifications to existing facilities will be required on or
along the proposed access route.

The access road will be constructed and maintained as necessary to prevent soil erosion and
accommodate all-weather traffic. The road will be crowned and ditched with water turnouts
installed as necessary to provide for proper drainage along the access road
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Construction activity willnot be conducted using frozen or saturated soils material or during
periods when watershed damage is likely to occur.

The access road and associated drainage structures will be constructed and maintained in
accordance with roading guidelines contained in the jointBLM/USFS publication: Surface
Operating Standards for Oil and Gas Exploration and Development, Third Edition, and/or
BLM Manual Section 9113 concerning road construction standards on projects subject to
federal jurisdiction.During the drilling and production phase of operations, the road surface
and shoulders will be kept in a safe and useable condition and drainage ditches and culverts
will be kept clear and free flowing.

Ifthe access road is dry during construction, drilling, and completion activities, water will be
applied to the access road to help facilitate road compaction (during construction) and to
minimize soil loss as a result of wind erosion.

3. LOCATION OF EXISTING WELLS WITHINA ONE-MILE RAolus:

See Topo Map C.

Water wells -0

Abandoned wells - 1
Temporarily Abandoned wells - 0
Disposal wells - 0
Drilling/Proposed wells - 0
Producing wells -4

Shut-in wells - 0
Injection wells - 0
Monitoring wells - 0

4. LocATioN OF EXISTING AND/OR PROPOSED PRODUCTION FACILITIES:

All production facilities will be located on the disturbed portion of the well pad and at a
minimum of 25 feet from the toe of the back slope.

Containment berms will be constructed completely around production facilities designed to
hold fluids (i.e., production tanks,produced water tanks, and/or heater/treater). The
containment berms will be constructed of compacted subsoil, be sufficientlyimpervious, hold
110 percent of the capacity of the largest tank, and be independent of the back cut.

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.

All permanent (on site six months or longer) aboveground structures constructed or installed
on location and not subject to safety requirements will be painted Carlsbad Canyon (Munsell
standard color 2.5y 6/2).

Gas meter runs for each wellwillbe located within 500 feet of the wellhead. The gas flow
line will be buried or anchored down from the wellhead to the meter and 500 feet downstream
of the meter run or any production facilities. Meter runs willbe housed and/or fenced.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be insta\\ed on the well location. The oil and gas
meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries. Tests for meter accuracy will
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conducted monthlyfor the first three monthson new meter installations and at least quarterly
thereafter. The Authorized Officer will be provided with a date and timefor the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will
be submitted to theVernal Field Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform with
Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oif and Gas Order
No. 5 for natural gas measurement.

All site security guidelines identified in 43 CFR 3162.7 regulations willbe adhered to.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-lease will have

prior written approval from the Authorized Officer.

5. LOCATION AND TYPE oF 1/VATERSUPPLY:

Water for drilling willbe obtained from the Dalbo Ouray Water Facility located in Section 32-

T4S-R3E, Water Use Claim #43-8496, Application #53617. No water supply well will be
drilled.

The water willbe transportedto location via truckby an approved commercial water haufer
over the access roads shown on Topo Maps A and B.

6. SOURCE OF ÛONSTRUCTION MATERIALS:

Surface and subsoil materials in the immediate area will be utilized. Any construction
materials that may be required for surfacing of the drillpad and access road will be obtained

from a contractor having a permitted source of materials within the general area.

The use of materials under BLMjurisdictionwillconform with 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

No construction materials willbe removed from Federal lands without prior approval.

7. METHODs oF HANDLING WASTEÜISPOSAL:

Cuttings and drilling fluids willbe contained in the reserve pit.

Tanks will be used for storage of produced fluids during testing. Fracture stimulation fluids

will be flowed back into the reserve pit for evaporation.

Portable, self-contained chemical toiletswill be provided for human waste disposal. Upon

completion of operations, or as required, the toilet holding tanks willbe pumped and the
contents thereof disposed of in an approved sewage disposal facility. All state and local laws

and regulations pertaining to disposal of human and solid waste will be complied with.

All garbage and non-flammablewaste materials will be contained in a self-contained, portable

dumpster or trash cage. Upon completion of operations, or as needed, the accumulated

trash will be transportedto a state approved waste disposal site. No trash willbe placed in

the reserve pit.

Immediately after removal of the drilling rig, all debris and other waste materials not

contained in the trash cage will be cleaned up and removed from the location. No potentially

adverse materials or substances will be left on the location. Any open pits will be
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during drilling operations and said fencing will be maintained untilsuch timeas the pits have
been backfilled.

After first production, produced wastewater will be confined to the approved pit or storage
tank for a period not to exceed 90 days. During the 90 day period, in accordance with
Onshore Order No. 7, an application for approval of a permanent disposal method and
location will be submitted for the Authorized Officer's approval.

Any spills of oil,gas, salt water, or other noxious fluids will be immediately cleaned up and
removed to an approved disposal site.

Operator maintains a file, per 29 CFR 1910.1200 (g)containing current Material Safety Data
Sheets (MSDS) for all chemicals, compounds, and/or substances which are used during the
course of construction, drilling, completion, and production operations for this project.
Hazardous materials (substances) which may be found at the site may include drilling mud
and cementíng products which are primarily inhalation hazards, fuels (flammable and/or
combustible), materials that may be necessary for wellcompletion/ stimulation activities such
as flammable or combustible substances and acids/gels (corrosives). The opportunity for
Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization Act (SARA) listed Extremely Hazardous
Substances (EHS) at the site is generally limited to proprietary treatingchemicals. All
hazardous and EHS and commercial preparations will be handled in an appropriate manner
to minimizethe potential for leaks or spills to the environment.

8. ANCILLARYFACILITIES:

None anticipated.

9. WELL SITE LAvouT:

A. General Information:

See the attached Location Layout and Typical Cross Sections diagrams showing the
proposed drill pad cross sections and cut and fills in relation to topographic features as
well as access onto the pad and soil stockpiles.

See the attached Typical Rig Layout diagram showing the location of the reserve pit, flare
pit, living facilities, and rig orientation with respect to the pad and other facilities.

If necessary, in order to divert surface runoff,a drainage ditch willbe constructed around
the upslope side of the well site.

All equipment and vehicles will be confined to the approved disturbed areas of this APD
(i.e., access road, wellpad, and spoil and topsoil storage areas).

The fillsection of the pad that supports the drilling rigand any other heavy equipment will
be
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B. Reserve Pit:

The reserve pitwillbe constructed in a way that minimizesthe accumulation of surface
precipitation runoff into the pit. This may be accomplished by appropriate placement of
subsoilltopsoilstorage areas and/or construction of berms or ditches.

The reserve pit will be fenced on three sides during drilling operations and the fourth side
will be fenced after the drilling rig moves off the location. Thirty-nine (39) inch net wire
will be used with at least one strand of barbed wire on top of the net wire. Barbed wire
will not be used if pipe or some typeof reinforcement rod is attached to the top of the
entire fence. The net wire willbe no more than two inches above the ground. The
barbed wire willbe three inches over the net wire. Total height of the fence will be at
least 42 inches. Corner posts will be cemented and/or braced in such a manner to keep
the fence tight at all times. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts willbe used between the
corner braces. Maximum distance between any 2 fence posts will not be greater than 16
feet. Allwire will be stretched using a stretching device before it is attached to the corner
posts.

Siphons, catchments, and/or absorbent pads willbe installed to keep hydrocarbons
produced by the drilling rig from entering the reserve pit. Hydrocarbons and
contaminated pads will be disposed of in accordance with DEQ requirements.

The reserve pit will be backfilled as soon as dry after drilling and completion operations
are finished. If natural evaporation of the reserve pit is not feasible, alternative rnethods
of drying, removal of fluids, or other treatment will be developed. Iffluids will be disposed
of by any method other than evaporation or hauling to a DEQ approved disposal pit, prior
approval from the Authorized Officer will be obtained.

If a liner is required, then the reserve pit willbe lined with a synthetic liner. The reserve
pit bottom and side walls shall be void of any sharp rocks that could puncture the liner.
The liner will be installed over smooth fillsubgrade that is free of pockets, loose rocks, or
other materials (i.e. sand, sifted dirt, or bentonite) that could damage the liner. The liner
will overlap the pit walls and be covered withdirt and/or rocks to hold it in place.

10. PLANS FOR RECLAMATION OF THE SURFACE:

Producing Locatlon:

• Immediately upon well completion,the location and surrounding area will be cleared
of all unused tubing,materials, trash, and debris not required for production.

• If a synthetic, nylon reinforced, liner is used, the excess liner will be cut off and
removed and the remaining liner will be torn and perforated while backfilling the
reserve pit. Alternatively, the pit will be pumped dry, the liner folded into the pit, and
the pit backfilled.

• Before any dirt work associated with location restoration takes place, the reserve pit
shall be as dry as possible. Alldebris in it willbe removed. Other waste and spoil
materials willbe disposed of immediately upon completion of
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• The reserve pit and that portion of the location not needed for production
facilitiesloperations willbe recontoured to the approximate natural contours. The
reserve pit will be reclaimed within 120 days from the date of well completion,
weather permitting. This will be completed by backfilling and crowning the pit to
prevent water from standing.

• Seeding willbe performed immediately after the location has been reclaimedand the
pit has been backfilled, regardless of the time of year. The Bureau of Land
Management willspecify a seed mixture. Seed will be broadcast and walked in with
a dozer, The topsoil stockpile will be seeded as soon as the location has been
constructed with the same recommended seed mix.

Dry Hole/Abandoned Location:

• On lands administered by the BLM,abandoned wellsites, roads, and other disturbed
areas will be restored as near as practical to their original condition. Where
applicable, these conditions may include the re-establishment of irrigation systems,
the re-establishment of appropriate soil conditions, and the re-establishment of
vegetation as specified.

• All disturbed surfaces will be recontoured to the approximate natural contours, with
reclamation of the well pad and access road to be performed as soon as practical
after final abandonment. Reseeding operations will be performed after completion
of other reclamation operations.

11. SURFACE OWNERSHIP:

Surface ownership of the proposed location is as follows:

Well Site & Access Road: Bureau of Land Management

12. OTHER INFORNIATION:

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with all applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil and Gas Orders, the approved Plan
of Operations, and any applicable Notice of Lessees. The operator is fully responsible for the
actions of its subcontractors. A complete copy of the approved "Application for Permit to
Drill"will be furnished to the field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on
location during all construction and drilling operations.

The Operator willcontrol noxious weeds along right-of-ways for roads, pipelines, well sites, or
other applicable facilities. A list of noxious weeds may be obtained from the BLM or the
appropriate County Extension Office. On BLMadministered land, it is required that a Pesticide
Use Proposal be submitted and approved prior to the application of herbicides or other pesticides
or possibly hazardous chemicals.

Drillingrigs and/or equipment used during drillingoperations on this location willnot be stacked
or stored on Federal Lands after the conclusion of drillingoperations or at any other timewithout
BLMauthorization. If BLMauthorization is obtained, such storage is only a temporary
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The Operator is responsible for informing all persons in the area who are associated with this
project thattheymaybe subject to prosecution for knowingly disturbinghistoric or archaeological
sites or for collecting artifacts. All vehicular traffic, personnel movement, construction, and
restoration activities shall be confined to the areas examined, as referenced in the archaeological
report, and to the existing roadways and/or evaluated access routes. If historic or
archaeological materials are uncovered during construction,the Operator is to immediately stop
work that might further disturb such materials and contact the Authorized Officer. Within five
working days, the Authorized Officer will inform the Operator as to:

• whether the materials appear eligible for the National Historic Register of Historic Places;

• the mitigationmeasures the Operator will likely have to undertake before the site can be
used (assuming in situ preservation is not necessary); and

• a timeframe for the Authorized Officer to complete an expedited review under 36 CFR
800.11 to confirm, throughthe State Historic Preservation Officer, thatthe findings of the
Authorized Officer are correct and that mitigation is appropriate.

• If the Operator wishes, at any time, to relocate activities to avoid the expense of
mitigation and/or the delays associated with this process, the Authorized Officer will
assume responsibility for whatever recordation and stabilization of the exposed materials
may be required. Otherwise the Operator willbe responsible for mitigation costs. The
Authorized Officer will provide technicaland procedural guidelines for the conduct of
mitigation. Upon verification from the Authorized Officer that required mitigationhas
been completed, the Operator will then be allowed to resume construction.

A Class IIIarcheological survey has been conducted by Metcalf Archeological Consultants.
No significant cultural resources were found and clearance is recommended. Metcalf
Archeological Consultants will submit a copy of this report to the appropriate agencies.

13. LESSEE OR OPERATOR's REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION:

Mike Decker
Pannonian Energy, Inc.
14 Inverness Drive East
Suite H-236
Englewood, Colorado 80112-5625
(303) 204-3880

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed
drill site and access route; that I am familiar withthe conditionswhich currently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by Pannonian Energy,
Inc., and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with this plan and the terms and
conditions under which it is approved.

Date Howard Sharpe, Vice
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13. LESSEE OR OPERATOR's REPRESENTATIVE AND CERTIFICATION:

Mike Decker
Pannonian Energy, Inc.
14 Inverness Drive East
Suite H-236
Englewood, Colorado 80112-5625
(303) 204-3880

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed
drill site and access route; that I am familiar withthe conditionswhich currently exist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, true and correct; and that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein will be performed by Pannonian Energy,
Inc., and its contractors and subcontractors in conformity with this plan and the terms and
conditions under which it is approved.

Date Howard Sharpe, Vice
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DOUBLE RAM TYPE PREVENTERS WITH AN OPTIONAL ROTATING HEAD

5000 psi system

Fill line Flow line

(OPTIONAL)

I I

A
Adjustable Choke

To Pit and/or Mud/Gas Separator

R 2" Minimum

Blowout Preventer
Stack Outlet Choke 3" Mn mum

Line Bleed Line To Pit

3" Minimum

R s.s..... o s..., † 2" Min imum
3" Minimum

CLhonkee To Pit and/or Mud/Gas2'SeM

m
•2 valves (1 check
valve) Adjustable Choke

i W

* Note: Kill line shall be 2" minimum diameter and have two valves, one of which shall be a check valve. Both valves: 2"
minimum.

Minimum BOP Stack 5000 psi Working Pressure

One Pipe Ram 5000 psi Working Pressure

One Blind Ram 5000 psi Working Pressure

One Annular 5000 psi Working Pressure

Well Head 5000 psi Working Pressure

Manifold 5000 psi Working
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LOCATION LAYOUT FOR
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Bev. Graded Ground at Location Stoke = as so. 200 East * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (435)
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PANNONIAN ENERGY, IN . , 30:
TYPICAL CROSS SECTION FORX-Section

scale FEDERAL #11-21-9-19
1" =

So. SECTION 21, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.

DATE: 11-19-01 577' FNL 522' FWL
DRAWN BY: D.COX

Preconstruction B mit
Grade 32 120

CUT

STA. J+15

10, 60' 32' 120'

LOCA T/0N STAKE

60 32 120'

Slope= 1 1/2: 1
Finished Grade (7)P J

32' 120'

STA. 0+00

APPROXIMATE YARDAGES EXCESS MATERIALAFTER

CUT 5% COMPACTION = 1,960 Cu. Yds.

(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,070 Cu. Yds. Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 1,960 Cu. Yds.
(1/2 Pit VoL)

Remaining Location = 5,820 Cu. Yds.
EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 6,890 CU.YDS. (After Rehobilitation)

FILL = 4,680 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 So. 200 East * Verruzi, Utah, 84078 • (435)
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: Pannonian Enerev, Inc.

Well Name & Number: Federal l1-21-9-19

API Number: ;
43-041- astook

Lease Number: U-78443

Location: NWNW Sec. 1 T.% R. 19E

Agreement: N/A

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval
for Notice to Drill and Surface Use Program.

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable

title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well

is being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

1. DRILLINGPROGRAM

1. Estimated Depth at Which Oil, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearing Zones are Expected
to be Encountered

Report ALL water shows and water-bearing sands to John Mayers of this office prior to setting

the next casing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies of State of Utah form
OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected, submit samples to this office

along with any water analyses conducted.

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLM at onsite)
encountered during drilling, will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas
shows will be tested to determine commercial
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

2. Pressure Control Equipment

Chart recorders shall be used for all pressure tests.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while drilling
and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

3. Casing Program and Auxiliary Equipment

In addition to the cementing proposal for the surface casing, Class G neat cement shall be placed
within the surface casing-conductor annulus from the surface down to a minimum of 200'

4. Mud Program and Circulating Medium

None

5. Coring, Logging and Testing Program

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to this office on a weekly
basis.

To evaluate cement quality across the usable water zone, a Cement Bond Log will be required
from the surface casing shoe to the base of the conductor pipe.

6. Notifications of Operations

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or workover
equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status without prior approval
of the AO. If operations are to be suspended, prior approval of the AO will be obtained and
notification given before resumption of operations.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "SundryNotice" (Form 3160-
5) to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this approved
plan are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.

The date on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for oil wells as the
date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporary storage facility,
such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or, the date on which
liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent storage facility, whichever first occurs;
and, for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped
from a temporary storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be
generated or, the date on which gas is first measured through permanent metering facilities,
whichever first occurs.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO will be notified when the well
is placed in a producing status. Written notification of such must be submitted to this office not
later than five (5) days following the date on which the well is placed on
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

Gas produced from this well may not be vented or flared beyond an initial authorized test period
of 30 days or 50 MMCF following its completion, whichever occurs first, without the prior
written approval of the Authorized Officer. Should gas be vented or flared without approval
beyond the authorized test period, the operator may be directed to shut-in the well until the gas
can be captured or approval to continue venting or flaring as uneconomic is granted and the
operator shall be required to compensate the lessor for that portion of the gas vented or flared
without approval which is determined to have been avoidably lost.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5(d) shall be submitted to the
appropriate Field Office within 60 days of installation or first production, whichever occurs first.
All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3 shall be adhered to.
All product lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectively sealed in
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (1).

No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior approval of the AO. In
the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergency situations, oral approval will be
obtained from the AO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form 3160-5, will be filed with

the AO within thirty (30) days following completion of the well for abandonment. This report

will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status of surface restoration. Final
abandonment will not be approved until the surface reclamation work required by the approved

APD or approved abandonment notice has been completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his
representative, or the appropriate Surface Managing Agency.

7. Other Information

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on lease or off-lease will have
prior written approval from the AO.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well location. The oil and gas

meters will be calibrated in place prior to any deliveries and tested for meter accuracy at least
quarterly thereafter. The AO will be provided with a date and time for the initial meter
calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will

be submitted to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will conform to
Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 5 for

.natural gas measurement.

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982, as implemented
by the applicable provisions of the operating regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-l(c), requires

that "not later than the 5th business day after any well begins production on which royalty is due
anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site, or resumes production in the case of a well

which has been off production for more than 90 days, the operator shall notify the authorized

officer by letter or sundry notice, Form 3160-5, or orally to be followed by a letter or sundry

notice, of the date on which such production has begun or
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

If you fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time allowed, you shall be liable
for a civil penalty of up to $10,000per violation for each day such violation continues, not to
exceed a maximum of 20 days. See Section 109(c)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty
Management Act of 1982 and the implementing regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(ii).

APD approval is valid for a period of one (1) year from the signature date. An extension period
may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Ed Forsman (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435)
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPT EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, they are not necessarily hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids

Gas plant cooling tower cleaning wastes

Painting wastes

Oil and gas service company wastes, such as empty drums, drum rinsate, vacuum truck rinsate,

sandblast media, painting wastes, spend solvents, spilled chemicals, and waste acids

Vacuum truck and drum rinsate from trucks and drums, transporting or containing nonexempt

waste

Refinery wastes

Liquid and solid wastes generated by crude oil and tank bottom reclaimers

Used equipment lubrication oils

Waste compressor oil, filters, and blowdown

Used hydraulic fluids

Waste solvents

Waste in transportation pipeline-related pits

Caustic or acid cleaners

Boiler cleaning wastes

Boiler refractory bricks

Incinerator ash

Laboratory wastes

Sanitary wastes

Pesticide wastes

Radioactive tracer wastes

Drums, insulation and miscellaneous
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Well No.: Federal 11-21-9-19

SURFACE USE PROGRAM

Conditions of Approval (COA)

Pannonian Energy, Inc. - Well No.s 11-21-9-19 & 22-22-9-19

Location and Type of Water Supply:

Your permit to drill identified that the Dalbo Ouray Water facility would be used as the water

supply for drilling. If any other water source is necessary it will require additional approval by

the authorized officer of the Vernal Field Office.

Source of Construction Materials:

Only subsurface soils will be used for construction. All top soils will be stockpiled and identified

in the APD for futurereclamation of disturbed areas.

Plans For Reclamation of Location:

All seeding for reclamation operations at this location shall use the following seed mixture:

Gardners saltbush Atriplex gardneri 3 lbs/acre
shadscale Atriplex confertifolia 3 lbs/acre
Indain rice grass Oryzopsishymenoides 2 lbs/acre
galleta grass Hilaria jamesii 4 Ibs/acre

If the seed mixture is to be aerially broadcasted, the pounds per acre shall be doubled. All seed

poundages are in Pure Live Seed.

Immediately after construction the stockpiled top soil will be seeded and the seed worked into

the soil by "walking" the pile with caterpillar
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SURFACE USE PROGRAM
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PANNONIAN ENERGY, INC.
FEDERAL #11-21-9-19

SECTION 21, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.

PROCEED IN A SOUTHWESTERLY DIRECTION FROM MYTON, UTAH ALONG U.S.
HIGHWAY 40 APPROXIMATELY 1.7 MILES TO THE JUNCTION THIS ROAD AND
AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A
SOUTHERLY THEN SOUTHWESTERLY THEN SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 11.0 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN
EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTHEAST; PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY THEN
EASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 6.4 MILES TO THE JUNCTION OF THIS
ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE EAST; PROCEED IN A EASTERLY THEN
SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 5.5 MILES TO THE JUNCTION
OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXISTING ROAD TO THE SOUTH; TURN RIGHT AND
PROCEED IN A SOUTHERLY DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 0.5 MILES TO THE
JUNCTION OF THIS ROAD AND AN EXITING RECLAIMED ROAD TO THE
SOUTHEAST; TURN LEFI' AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY DIRECTION
APPROXIMATELY 0.6 MILES TO THE BEGINNING OF THE PROPOSED ACCESS
TO THE SOUTHEAST; TURN LEFT AND PROCEED IN A SOUTHEASTERLY
DIRECTION APPROXIMATELY 250' TO THE PROPOSED



e WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 05/17/2002 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-34608

WELL NAME: FEDERAL 11-21-9-19

OPERATOR: PANNONIAN ENERGY INC ( N1815 )

CONTACT: HOWARD SHARPE PHONE NUMBER: 303-483-0044

PROPOSED LOCATION:
INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

NWNW 21 090S 190E

SURFACE: 0577 FNL 0522 FWL Tech Review Initials Date

BOTTOM: 0577 FNL 0522 FWL
Engineering

UINTAE

PARIETTE BENCH ( 640 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-78433

SURFACE OWNER: 1 - Federal LATITUDE: 40.02192

PROPOSED FORMATION: WSMVD LONGITUDE: 109.79233

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

y/ Plat R649-2-3.

v/ Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit

CRo. 4127759 )
Potash (Y/N) V R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

t/' Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
Q¾o.43-8496 )

Drilling Unit$1 RDCC Review (Y/N)
Board Cause No:(Date: )
Eff Date:

$JA Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting:

R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: gµ¿ Í$ ()l

STIPULATIONS: |-
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Energy

State of Utah
Department of Natural Resources 20 May 2002
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P.O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801

Attn: Lisha Cordova

Re; Latham Federal 22-22-9-19
Federal 11-21-9-19

Dear Lisha,

The purpose of this letter is to comply with your telephone request for Gasco to
submit the enclosed Sundry Notices to rescind the referenced "reentry" well APD's.
Please know that we could not re-enter due to the mechanics of the existing well boars.
Gasco will move over a few feet on the existing pads and drill a new well.

If you have questions please call me toll free at 877-627-8637

Thank you,

Howard O. Sharpe

P.S. Pannonian Energy Inc. (a Delaware Corp.) is a wholly owned subsidiary of Gasco
Energy, Inc (a Nevada Corp.)

GASCOEnergy, Inc.
14 inverness Drive East, Suite H-236 Tel: (303) 483-0044 Email: invest@gascoenergy.com
Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: (303) 483-0011 Website: www.gascoenergy.com 0TCBB:
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STATE OF UTAH FORM 9DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

UTU - 78433
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME:SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS N/A
7. UNITor CAAGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to N/Adrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.
1.TYPEOFWELL

OILWELL GASWELL OTHER
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR:

9.APINUMBER:Pannonian Energy (a whollyowned subsidiary of Gasco Energy,lnc.)
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR:

PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WILDCAT:14 Inverness Dr. East egy Englewood CO »,80112 (303) 483-0044 River bend4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 57T FNL & 522, FWL
COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NWNW 21 T9S R19 E STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATATYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELLApproximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON
O CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS O OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBlNG PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLAREO SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGEWELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFFDate of work completion:

O COMMINGLE PRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Update the APDO CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION PISBSS inSert
12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show att pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.
Please insert the attached pages to the APD.

NAME(PLEASE PR NT) Howard Sharpe
TITLE VÌCO PTOSident & Secretary

SIGNATURE C
DATE

(This space for State e oni

(5/2000)
(See Instructions on Reverse
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Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-78433

APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORREENTER 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

N/A
la. Type of Work: DRILL REENTER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.

b. Type of Well: Oil Wel Gas Well Other Single Zone Multiple Zone Federal 11-21-9-19
2. Name of Operator 9. API Well No.

Pannonian Ener y, Inc.
3A. Address b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

14 inverness Dr. E., Englewood, CO 80112 (303) 483-0044 Riverbend
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Bik, and Survey or Area
At surface 577' FNL & 522' FWL (NWNW)
At proposedprod. Zone Section 21-T9S-R19E
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately 25.8 miles from Myton, Utah Uintah UT
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit declicatedto this welllocation to nearest

property or lease line, it. 522'
(Also to nearest drig. unit line, if any) 996.37 40

18. Distance from proposed location*
19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on fileto nearest well, drillmg, completed, See Map

applied for, on this lease, ft 12,500 Utah BLM Bond No. 4127759

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration
4763' GL Upon Approval 35 days

24. Attachments
The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

tieSignature Name

(Prina

H ard Sharpe
Date

App
NCane

(Pr nt dT ed) D

Title ASSIStant Ë"leldMana .office

MneralResourc
Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct
operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within itsjurisdiction.
*(Instru

lyE60NDITl0NSOFAPPROM
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PANNONIAN ENERGY, INC.

Federal 11-21-9-19
NWNW, Section 21-T9S-R19E

Uintah County, Utah
Lease No. UTU-78433

DRILLING PLAN

1. ESTIMATED ToPS OF IMPORTANT GEOLOGIC MARKERS & ANTICIPATED WATER, OIL, GAS

OR MINERAL FORMATIONS:

I

Depth Hydrocarbon/Water
Formation (ft) Bearing Zënes

Uintah Surface

Green River 1,933' Gas/Oil

Wasatch 5,483' Gas

Mesa Verde 8,800' Gas

TD 12,500'

Allusable (<10,000ppm TDS) water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by

BLMat onsite) encountered during drilling willbe recorded by depth and adequately
protected. All significant oil and gas shows willbe tested to determine commercial potential.

This information shall be reported to the Vernal BLMOffice.

2. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT:

Allwell control equipment shall be in accordance with Onshore Order #2 for SM systems.

The minimum specifications for pressure control equipment that will be provided are included

on the attached schematic diagram showing size, pressure ratings, testing procedures, and

testing frequency.

5000# BOP With 4-1/2" Pipe Rams
5000# BOP With Blind Rams
5000# Annular

Auxiliary equipment to be used:
014 GASANDMININe

• Upper kelly cocks with handle available.

The manifold includes appropriate valves and adjustable chokes. The kill line will have one

check valve. Ram type preventers will be pressure tested to full working pressure (utilizing a

test plug)
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Mesa Verde 8,800' Gas

TD 12,500'

Allusable (<10,000ppm TDS) water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by

BLMat onsite) encountered during drilling willbe recorded by depth and adequately
protected. All significant oil and gas shows willbe tested to determine commercial potential.

This information shall be reported to the Vernal BLMOffice.

2. PRESSURE CONTROL EQUIPMENT:

Allwell control equipment shall be in accordance with Onshore Order #2 for SM systems.

The minimum specifications for pressure control equipment that will be provided are included

on the attached schematic diagram showing size, pressure ratings, testing procedures, and

testing frequency.

5000# BOP With 4-1/2" Pipe Rams
5000# BOP With Blind Rams
5000# Annular

Auxiliary equipment to be used:
014 GASANDMININe

• Upper kelly cocks with handle available.

The manifold includes appropriate valves and adjustable chokes. The kill line will have one

check valve. Ram type preventers will be pressure tested to full working pressure (utilizing a

test plug)
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• initial installation;
• whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken;
• following related repairs;
• at 30 day intervals

The annular preventer will be pressure tested to 50 percent of the rated working pressure.

Allpressure tests shall be maintained at least ten minutes or until provisions of test are met,

whichever is longer.

Annular preventers shall be functionally operated at least weekly.

Pipe and blind rams shall be activated each trip.

A BOPE pit level drillwill be conducted weekly for each drilling crew.

Alltests and drills will be recorded in the drilling log.

The accumulator will have sufficient capacity to open the HCR valve, close a\\ rams plus the

annular preventer, and retain 200 psi above pre-charge pressure without the use of closing

unit pumps. The system will have two independent power sources to close the preventers in

accordance with 5M system requirements outlined in Onshore Order #2.

Remote controls shall be readily accessible to the driller. Master controls shall be at the
accumulator.

3. CASING & CEMENTING PROGRAM:

A. The proposed casing program will be as follows:

Hole
D th Nze Size Grade Weight Thread Corulition
0-220' 17 ½" 13 3/8" H-40 48#lft ST&C New

0-3,500 12-1/4" 9-5/8" J-55 40#lft LT&C New

0-TD 7-7/8" 4-1/2" P-110 13.5#lft LT&C New

The proposed casing and cementing program shall be conducted as approved to protect

and/or isolate all usable water zones, potentially productive zones, lost circulation zones,

abnormally pressured zones, and any prospectively valuable deposits of minerals. Any

isolating medium other than cement shall receive approva\ prior to use. The casing setting

depth shall be calculated to position the casing seat opposite a competent formation which

will contain the ma×imum pressure to which it will be exposed during normal drilling

operations. Determination of casing setting depth shall be based on all relevant factors,

including: presencelabsence of hydrocarbons, fracture gradie ater zones,

formation pressures, lost circulation zones, other minerals, or oth s.

Allcasing, except conductor casing, shall be new or reconditioned and casing

shall meet or exceed API standards for new casing.
OfVISIONOFOft, GAS AND
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The surface casing shall be cemented back to surface either during the primary cement job

or by remedial cementing. Ifdrive pipe is used, itmay be left in place if its totallength is less

than twentyfeet below the surface. Ifthe total length of the drive pipe is equal to or greater

than twentyfeet, it willbe pulled prior to cementing surface casing, or itwillbe cemented in

place.

Top plugs shall be used to reduce contamination of cement by displacement fluid. A bottom

plug or other acceptable technique, such as a suitable preflush fluid, inner string cement

method, etc., shall be utilized to help isolate the cement from contamination by the mud

being displaced ahead of the cement slurry.

Allcasing strings below the conductor shall be pressure tested to 0.22 psi per foot of casing

string length or to 1500 psi, whichever is greater, but not to exceed 70% of the minimum

internal yield. Ifpressure declines more than 10% in 30 minutes, corrective action shall be

taken.

The bottom three joints of the surface casing will have one centralizer per joint and one

centralizer every fourth joint thereafter.

Casing design subject to revision based on geologic conditions encountered.

B. The proposed cementing program willbe as follows:

Conductor String: Cement will be circulated to surface. Estimated volume (100%

over theoretical value) 260 sxs Class "G", 3% CaCl2 Wl0.25 #lsx
Flocele @ 15.6 ppg, 1.19 ft3

Surface String: Cement will be circulated to surface. Estimated volume (35%

over theoretical value):

Lead: 465 s× Hifill@12.0 ppg, 2.87 ft3/sx.

Taíl: 380 sx Class "G" 2% CaCl2 @15.8 ppg, 1.16 ft3/sx.

Production String: Estimated volume (gaugehole + 15%):

Lead: 450 sx Hifill@ 11.0 ppg, 3.84 ft3/sx.

Tail: 1790 sx 50/50 POZ @14.35 ppg, 1.26 ft3

Actual volumes willbe calculated and adjusted with caliper log prior to cementing. Ten

percent excess willbe pumped.

For surface casing, waiting on cement timewill be adequate to achieve 500 psi compressive

strength at the casing shoe prior to drilling out.

Anticipated cement tops willbe reported as to depth, not the exp pf

cement to be used. The Vernal District BLMOffice willbe notifie , i t i ,

in order to have a BLM representative on location while running all. casing strings and

cementing. .

M 2 À
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After cementing the surface pipe and/or any intermediate strings, but before commencing

any test, the casing string shall stand cemented until the cement has reached a compressive

4.

DRILLrength ofDat least 500A i at the shoe. WOC time shall be recorded in the Driller's Log.

Weight Water

Interval Type (ppg) Viscosity pH Loss Remarks

0-400' Spud 8.4 -9.0
30-45+ 8.0 NC Gel & lime as

required.

400'-Top of Wtr/gel 8.4-8.8 27-35 8.5-9.0 NC Min. Wt.

Wasatch
Top of KCL 8.5- 35-45 9.0-11.0 10-15cc * Min Wt. to control

Wasatch-TD Mud
11.2* @TD formation pressure.

NC = no control

Sufficient quantities of mud material willbe maintained on site or be readily accessible for

the purpose of assuring well control. SPR will be recorded on daily driffingreport after

mudding up. Visual mud monitoringwillbe conducted during operations.

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and/or Indian lands without

prior BLMapproval to ensure adequate protection of fresh water aquifers.

No chemicals subject to reporting under SARA Title Ill in an amount equal to or greater than

10,000 pounds will be used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of annually in

association with the drilling, testing, or completing of this well. Furthermore, no extremely

hazardous substances, as defined in 40 CFR 355, in threshold planning quantities, willbe

used, produced, stored, transported, or disposed of in association with the drilling, testing,or

completing of this well.

5. EVALUATION PROGRAM:

Logs: DLLT/GR: TD to base surface casing
SDL/DSN/GR/CAL: TD to 300' above Green River

MRIL: TD to 100' above Wasatch
(at operators discretion)

Cores: None anticipated.

DST's: None anticipated.

When cement has not been circulated to surface, the cement top willbe determined by

either a temperature survey or cement bond log. Should a temperature survey fail to locate

theMcemecnttop, a cement bond log wil\ be run. A field copy will be su t

Drill stem tests, if they are run, willadhere to the following
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Initial opening of the drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours unless
specific approval to start during other hours is obtained from the Authorized Officer.
However, DST's may be allowed to continue at night if the test was initiated during
daylight hours and the rate of flow is stabilized and ifadequate lighting is available (i.e.,
lighting which is adequate for visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can
be released, but trippingshall not begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained
from the Authorized Officer. Closed chamber DST's may be performed day or night.

Some means of reverse circulation shall be provided in case of flow to the surface
showing evidence of hydrocarbons.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly installed
before a test starts.

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to be operational during
the test shall have spark arresters or water-cooled exhausts.

6. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

No anticipated abnormal pressures or temperatures are expected to be encountered. No
hydrogen sulfide is expected.

Anticipated Maximum bottom-hole pressure is 6825 psi.

7. OTHER INFORMATION:

The anticipated starting date and duration of the operation willbe as follows:

Starting Date: Upon Approval
Duration: 35 DrillingDays & 20 Completion Days

lf the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, Well Completion or Recompletion
Report and Log (Form 3160-4) willbe submitted within 30 days after completion of the well
or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3160. Copies
of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well test data, geologic summaries, sample
descriptions, daily drilling reports, daily completion reports, and all other surveys or data
obtained and compiled during the drilling, completion, and/or workover operations, willbe
submitted direct\y to the Authorized Officer or filed with Form 3160-4.

The use of materials under BLMjurisdictionwill conform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

Deviations from the proposed drilling and/or workover program willbe approved by the
Authorized Officer. Safe drilling and operating practices willbe observed. All wells, whether
drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, willbe identified in accordance with 43 CFR
S16n2dry

Notice and Report on Wells" (form 3160-5) willbe filed for appr I
of plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR

O O
Federal 11-21-9-19
Drilling Plan Page 5

Initial opening of the drill stem test tools shall be restricted to daylight hours unless
specific approval to start during other hours is obtained from the Authorized Officer.
However, DST's may be allowed to continue at night if the test was initiated during
daylight hours and the rate of flow is stabilized and ifadequate lighting is available (i.e.,
lighting which is adequate for visibility and vapor-proof for safe operations). Packers can
be released, but trippingshall not begin before daylight, unless prior approval is obtained
from the Authorized Officer. Closed chamber DST's may be performed day or night.

Some means of reverse circulation shall be provided in case of flow to the surface
showing evidence of hydrocarbons.

Separation equipment required for the anticipated recovery shall be properly installed
before a test starts.

All engines within 100 feet of the wellbore that are required to be operational during
the test shall have spark arresters or water-cooled exhausts.

6. ABNORMAL CONDITIONS:

No anticipated abnormal pressures or temperatures are expected to be encountered. No
hydrogen sulfide is expected.

Anticipated Maximum bottom-hole pressure is 6825 psi.

7. OTHER INFORMATION:

The anticipated starting date and duration of the operation willbe as follows:

Starting Date: Upon Approval
Duration: 35 DrillingDays & 20 Completion Days

lf the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, Well Completion or Recompletion
Report and Log (Form 3160-4) willbe submitted within 30 days after completion of the well
or after completion of operations being performed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3160. Copies
of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses, well test data, geologic summaries, sample
descriptions, daily drilling reports, daily completion reports, and all other surveys or data
obtained and compiled during the drilling, completion, and/or workover operations, willbe
submitted direct\y to the Authorized Officer or filed with Form 3160-4.

The use of materials under BLMjurisdictionwill conform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

Deviations from the proposed drilling and/or workover program willbe approved by the
Authorized Officer. Safe drilling and operating practices willbe observed. All wells, whether
drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned, willbe identified in accordance with 43 CFR
S16n2dry

Notice and Report on Wells" (form 3160-5) willbe filed for appr I
of plans and other operations in accordance with 43 CFR



O O
Federal 11-21-9-19
Drilling Plan Page 6

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that fullcompliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil and Gas Orders No. 1 and No.
2, and the approved Plan of Operations. The Operator is fullyresponsible for the actions of its
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions willbe furnished to the field representative to ensure
compliance.
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statfofUtah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Michael O. Leavitt PO Box 145801Governor
Kathleen Clarke Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Executive Director 801-538-5340

Lowell P. Braxton 801-359-3940 (Fax)
• Division Director 801-538-7223 (TDD)

June 11, 2002

Pannonian Energy Inc
14 Inverness Dr. East
Englewood CO 80112

Re: Federal 11-21-9-19 Well, 577' FNL, 522' FWL, NW NW, Sec. 21, T. 9 South, R. 19 East,
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-34608.

Sincerely,

John R. Baza
Associate Director

pb
Enclosures
cc: Uintah County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District
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Operator: Pannonian Energy Inc
Well Name & Number Federal 11-21-9-19

API Number: 43-047-34608
Lease: UTU-78433

Location: NW NW Sec. 21 T. 9 South R. 19 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to drilling.

5. This proposed well is located in an area for which drilling units (well spacing patterns) have
not been established through an order of the Board of Oil, Gas and Mining (the "Board").
In order to avoid the possibility of waste or injury to correlative rights, the operator is
requested, once the well has been drilled, completed, and has produced, to analyze
geological and engineering data generated therefrom, as well as any similar data from
surrounding areas if available. As soon as is practicable after completion of its analysis,
and if the analysis suggests an area larger than the quarter-quarter section upon which the
well is located is being drained, the operator is requested to seek an appropriate order
from the Board establishing drilling and spacing units in conformance with such analysis
by filing a Request for Agency Action with the
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DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
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Utah Division ofOil, Gas and Mi i g

14. I hemby Cettity tha aregoingis trus and corroel
CO SUllant for

Name a sinnet ) PannonlanEnergy,1nc. out. 08/26¾
(State Use Only)

(8/90) See Instructions on Reverse

08/26/2003 13: 41 PERMI O + 18013593940 NO.996 902

Forme STATEOF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DMSIONOFOlL,GASANDMINING 8, t.egseDesignathnendSeda(ÑMmber
UTU-78433

7. Indian Allotteeet Tribe NameSUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTS ON WELLS N/A
Donotus thisfunnforproposalsmén11newwels,deepenexistingmelle,ortoteenterpillggedandebendonedwella. 8. Unitor CommunitiationAgreement

useAPPl.fGATIONFORPGRMIT..forstá pegosals gg
1. YypeofWell 9. Wall Nameand Nufnþer

O i Ð y, Oom•«<ssem Federalil1•21-9-19
2. NameofOperator 10. APIWellNumber

PannonlanEnergy,Inc. g ®¾7-34608
3. Address of0perator 4, TelephoneNuthbor 11. FieldandPool, orWildcat

14InvemesspriveEast,Suite#H236,EngleWood, CO80112 303/483-0044 Riverband
S. Location ofWell

Footage : 577 FNI.and522'FW1. county : Ulntah
0.s•c.LA. : NWNWSec.21,T95-RigE state : 01ah

12. CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOXEs TOINI ICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT,OR OTHERDATA
NOTICEOF INTENY SUBSEGUENTREPORT

(Butmit in Duplicate) (SubmitOriginalFormonly)
O =·=••e=• O -o-con e...am.nt · New Construction

Casme Repair Pußer Alter Casing Ga&g Repg Puß« Mer Cong
Change of Plan Recompletion ChangeofPlans Shmm
Conversionto lection ShootorAcidize Converslento injection Ventor Flere
FractureTreat Vent or Flare Frectwe Yreat WaterShutoff
MultipleCompledon Water Snut-Off Other[¯] other Request1yearextensionofAPD

Dateof Work Completion
I Approxirnaisostewe willstan

tapartresultsofMultipleCompletionsaridRecornpletionstogliferenlfDEGFVOFFS
anWEI.6 COMPLETIONORRECOMAI.ETIONANDLOGform.
* Mustbe accompanledby a gement vatlfloationreport.

13. DESCRIBiPROPOSED084COMPLETEDOPERATIONS(Cleanystate allpertinentdetals, andgivopertinent datos, ifwel is directionallyarged,glVesubsurface
locatiertsatti maa ary!trtlevenlealdepms forGImarkersandzonasperdnenitoinis war¾)

PannonlanEnergy,Inc.requestsaoneyearextenalenofthesubjectAPD.

Approved by the
Utah Division ofOil, Gas and Mi i g

14. I hemby Cettity tha aregoingis trus and corroel
CO SUllant for

Name a sinnet ) PannonlanEnergy,1nc. out. 08/26¾
(State Use Only)

(8/90) See Instructions on Reverse



Application for Permit to Drill
Request for Permit Extension

Validation
(thisform should accompany the Sundry Notice requesting permit extension)

API: i
-3¯4

8
¯¯

Well Name: Federal #11-21-9-19

Location: NW NW Sec. 21, T9S - R19E
Company Permit Issued to: Pannonian Energy, Inc.
Date Original Permit Issued: 6/11/2002

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drillon the property as permitted
above, hereby verifies that the information as submitted in the previously
approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require revision.

Followinq is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be
verified.

If located on private land, has the ownership changed, if so, has the surface
agreement been updated? YesO NoO

Have any wells been drilled in the vicinityof the proposed well which would affect
the spacing or siting requirements for this location? YesO NoB

Has there been any unit or other agreements put in place thatcould affect the
permitting or operation of this proposed well? YesO NoO

Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership, or right-
of-way, which could affect the proposed location? YesO NoO

Has the approved source of water for drilling changed? YesO No2

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route
which willrequire a change in plans from what was discussed at the onsite
evaluation? Yes O NoB

Is bonding still in place, which covers this proposed well? Yes2NoO

8/18/2003

Signature Date

Title: Land Manager

Representing: Pannonian Energy,
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8
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Title: Land Manager

Representing: Pannonian Energy,



. Eorm 3160-3 . FORM APPROVED

(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES AUG2 0 003 ExpiresNovember30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 5. Lease Serial No.
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT UTU-78433

6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name0 05 APPLICATIONFORPERMITTODRILLORKbbN IbK N/A
l a. Type of Work: DRILL REENTER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.

N/A
8. Lease Name and Well No.

b. Type of Well: 00 Well Gas Well Oder Single Zone Multiple Zone Federal#11-21-9-19
2. Name of Operator 303/483-0044 14 Inverness DriveEast 9. API Well No.

Pannonian Energy, Inc. Englewood,CO80112 (§ gl • |
3. Name of Agent 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

Riverbend
4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk, and Survey or Area

At surface 57T FNLand 522' FWL Sec. 21,T9S-R19E
At proposed prod. zone NWNW
14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

Approximately25.8 milessoutheastof Myton,UT Uintah UT
15. Distance from proposed* 16. No. of Acres in lease 17. Spacing Unit<edicated to this well

location to nearest
property or lease line, n

. - 522'(Also to nearest drig. umt Ime, if any) 996.37 40 Acres
18. Distance from proposed location* 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file

to nearest well, dnlling, completed,
applied for, on this lease, f None 12,500' UtahBLMBond No.UT-1233

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KDB, RT, GL, etc.) 22. Approximate date work will start* 23. Estimated duration

4763' GL UponApproval 35 Days
24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, 5. Operator certification.

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office. 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

CgNRDENTIAL-TIGHTHOLE
authorized office.

25. Si Name (Printed/Typed) ' Date

/J -
- . DarrellFinneman 8/18/2003

Title

Land anagerfor Pannon' Energy, Inc. ¿ ,

Application approval does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to
conduct operations thereon.

NOTICECFAPPROVALConditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the
United States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

RECEIVED
*(Instructionsonreverse)

.cc OgicNS OFAPPROVALATTACHES2 9ma
Pio e nil.,GAS&
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Well No.: FEDERAL 11-21-9-19

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

Company/Operator: PANNONIAN ENERGY INC.

Well Name &Number: FEDERAL 11-21-9-19

e

sNeNmbm

er :

4 4 &7384463038

Location: NWNW Sec. 21 TWN: 09S RNG: 19E

Agreement: N/A

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval

for Notice to Drilland Surface Use
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Well No.: FEDERAL 11-21-9-19

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL FOR NOTlCE TO DRILL

Approval of this application does not warrant or certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable
title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations
thereon.

Submit an electronic copy of all logs run on this well in LAS format. This submission will
replace the requirement for submittal of paper logs to the BLM.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/or when well is
being drilled. Contact the appropriate Surface Management Agency for information.

A. DRILLING PROGRAM

1. Estimated Depth at Which Oil, Gas, Water, or Other Mineral Bearinq Zones are
Expected to be Encountered

Report Al water shows and water-bearing sands encountered to John Mayers of this
office prior to setting the next casing string or requesting plugging orders. Faxed copies
of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If noticeable water flows are detected,
submit samples to this office along with any water analyses conducted.

All usable water and prospectively valuable minerals (as described by BLMat onsite)
encountered during drilling will be recorded by depth and adequately protected. Alloil
and gas shows will be tested to determine commercial potential.

2. Pressure Control Equipment

The BOP and related equipment shall meet the minimum requirements of Onshore Off
and Gas Order No. 2 for equipment and testing requirements, procedures, etc., for a .3M
system and individual components shall be operable as designed. Chart recorders shall
be used for all pressure tests.

Test charts, with individual test results identified, shall be maintained on location while
drilling and shall be made available to a BLM representative upon request.

If an air compressor is on location and is being utilized to provide air for the drilling
medium while drilling, the special drilling requirements in Onshore Oil and Gas Order No.
2, regarding air or gas drilling shall be adhered to. If a mist system is being utilized then
the requirement for a deduster shall be waived.

3. Casinq Program and Auxiliarv Equipment

Su face casing shall have centralizers on the bottom three joints, with a minimum of one
centralizer per joint. Surface casing setting depths are based on ground level elevations
only.

In addition, to the cementing proposal for the surface casing, a minimumof 200 ft. of
Class G neat cement shall be placed from 200 ft. to surface in the 9 5/8" X 13 3/8"
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Well No.: FEDERAL 11-21-9-19

As a minimum, the usable water shall be isolated and/or protected by having a cement

top for the production casing at least 200 ft. above the surface casing shoe proposed at

3,500 ft. Ifgilsonite is encountered while drilling, it shall be isolated and/or protected via

the cementing program.

4. Mud Program and Circulatina Medium

Hazardous substances specifically listed by the EPA as a hazardous waste or

demonstrating a characteristic of a hazardous waste will not be used in drilling, testing, or

completion operations.

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal and Indian lands

without prior BLM approval to ensure adequate protection of fresh water aquifers.

5. Coring, Loqqinq and Testing Program

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted to this officeon a

weekly basis.

All DrillStem tests (DST) shall be accomplished during daylight hours, unless specific

approval to start during other hours is obtained from the AO. However, DSTs may be

allowed to continue at night if the test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate of

flow is stabilized and ifadequate lighting is available (i.e., lighting which is adequate for

visibility and vapor proof for safe operations). Packers can be released, but tripping

should not begin before daylight unless prior approval is obtained from the AO.

A cement bond log (CBL) will be run from the production casing shoe to top of the
cement and shall be utilized to determine the bond quality for the production casing.

Submit a field copy of the CBL to this office.

Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer, "Well Completion and

Recompletion Report and Log" (Form 3160-4) willbe submitted not later than 30 days

after completion of the well or after completion of operations being performed, in

accordance with 43 CFR 3164. Two copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analyses,

well-test data, geologic summaries, sample description, and all other surveys or data

obtained and compiled during the drilling, workover, and/or completion operations, will be

filed with Form 3160-4. Samples (cuttings, fluids, and/or gases) will be submitted when

requested by the AO.

6. Notifications of Operations

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will be plugged, and no drilling or
workover equipment will be removed from a well to be placed in a suspended status

without prior approval of the AO. Ifoperations are to be suspended, prior approval of the

AO will be obtained and notification given before resumption of operations.

Operator shall report production data to MMS pursuant to 30 CFR 216.5 using form
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Well No.: FEDERAL 11-21-9-19

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks, accidents, or any other unusual
occurrences shall be promptly reported in accordance with the requirements of NTL-3A

or its revision.

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completion operations, a "Sundry Notice" (Form
3160-5) to that effect will be filed, for prior approval of the AO, and all conditions of this
approved plan are applicable during all operations conducted with the replacement rig.
The date on which production is commenced or resumed will be construed for oil wells
as the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporary
storage facility, such as a test tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated
or, the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into a permanent storage
facility, whichever first occurs; and, for gas wells as the date on which associated liquid
hydrocarbons are first sold or shipped from a temporarystorage facility, such as a test
tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or, the date on which gas is
first measured through permanent metering facilities,whichever first occurs.

Should the well be successfully completed for production, the AO willbe notified when
the well is placed in a producing status. Such notification will be sent by telegram or
other written communication, not later than five (5) days following the date on which the
well is placed on production.

Gas produced from this well may not be vented or flared beyond an initial authorized test
period of 30 days or 50 MMCF followingits completion, whichever occurs first, without
the prior written approval of the Authorized Officer. Should gas be vented or flared
without approval beyond the authorized test period, the operator may be directed to shut-
in the well until the gas can be captured or approval to continue venting or flaring as
uneconomic is granted and the operator shall be required to compensate the lessor for
that portion of the gas vented or flared without approval which is determined to have
been avoidably lost.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR 3162.7-5(d) shall be submitted to
the appropriate Field Office within 60 days of installation or first production, whichever
occurs first. All site security regulations as specified in Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 3
shall be adhered to. Allproduct lines entering and leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will
be effectively sealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-5 (1).

No well abandonment operations will be commenced without the prior approval of the
AO. In the case of newly drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergency situations, oral
approval will be obtained from the AO. A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" Form
3160-5, willbe filed with the AO withinthirty (30) days following comp\etion of the well for
abandonment. This report will indicate where plugs were placed and the current status
of surface restoration. Final abandonment will not be approved until the surface
reclamation work required by the approved APD or approved abandonment notice has
been completed to the satisfaction of the AO or his representative, or the appropriate
Surface Managing Agency.

7. Other Information

All loading lines will be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank battery.
Alloff-lease storage, off-\ease measurement, or commingling on-lease or off-\ease will
have prior written approval from the
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The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on h

wNellloFEDERAL1e1-21 -19

gas meters willbe calibrated in place prior to any deliveries and tested for meter
accuracy at least quarterly thereafter. The AO willbe provided with a date and time for
the initial meter calibration and all future meter proving schedules. A copy of the meter
calibration reports willbe submitted to the Vernal District Office.

All meter measurement facilities will conform with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 4 for
liquid hydrocarbons and Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas measurement.

The use of materials under BLMjurisdictionwillconform to 43 CFR 3610.2-3.

There willbe no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover program without
prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and operating practices must be observed. All
wells, whether drilling, producing, suspended, or abandoned willbe identified ín
accordance with 43 CFR 3162.

"Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) willbe filed for approval for all
changes of plans and other operations in accordance with43 CFR 3162.3-2.

Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982, as
implemented by the applicable provisions of the operating regulations at Title 43 CFR
3162.4-1(c), requires that "not later than the 5th business day after any well begins
production on which royalty is due anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site,
or resumes production in the case of a well which has been off production for more than
90 days, the operator shall notify the authorized officer by letter or sundry notice, Form
3160-5, or orally to be followed by a letter or sundry notice, of the date on which such
production has begun or resumed."

Ifyou fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time allowed, you shall be
liable for a civil penalty of up to $10,000per violation for each day such violation
continues, not to e×ceed a maximum of 20 days. See Section 109(c)(3) of the Federal

Oil and Gas Royalty Management Act of 1982 and the implementing regulations at Title

43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(S)(ii).

APD approval is valid for a period of one (1) year from the signature date. An extension

period may be granted, if requested, prior to the expiration of the original approval period.

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, you must contact one of the following
individuals:

Ed Forsman (435) 828-7874
Petroleum Engineer

Kirk Fleetwood (435) 828-7875
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (435)
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Well No.: FEDERAL 11-21-9-19

EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPT EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, they are not necessarily hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids

Gas plant cooling towercleaning wastes

Painting wastes

Oil and gas service company wastes, such as empty drums, drum rinsate, vacuum truckrinsate,

sandblast media, painting wastes, spend solvents, spilled chemicals, and waste acids

Vacuum truck and drum rinsate from trucks and drums, transporting or containing nonexempt

waste

Refinery wastes

Liquid and solid wastes generated by crude oil and tank bottom recialmers

Used equipment lubrication oils

Waste compressor oil, filters, and blowdown

Used hydraulic fluids

Waste solvents
Waste in transportation pipeline-related pits

Caustic or acid cleaners

Boiler cleaning wastes

Boiler refractory bricks

Incinerator ash
Laboratory wastes

Sanitary wastes

Pesticide wastes

Radioactive tracer wastes

Drums, insulation and miscellaneous
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Well No.: FEDERAL 11-21-9-19

CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL
FOR THE SURFACE USE PROGRAM OF THE

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

-The location topsoil topsoilpile shall be windrow as shown on the cut sheet.

-The reserve pit topsoil should be piled separate from the location topsoil.

-The reserve pit shall be lined with a felt liner prior to installing a nylon reinforced plastic
liner. The plastic liner shall be of at least 12 mils in thickness.

-The location topsoil pile willbe seeded immediately after the soil is piled by broadcasting
the seed, thenwalking the topsoil pile with the dozer to plant the seed. The following seed
mixshall be used for seeding the topsoil,reserve pit, and for final reclamation.

Gardner saltbush Atriplex gardneri 3 lbslacre
Shadscale Atriplex confertifolia 3 lbslacre
Indian ricegrass Oryzopsis hymenoides 2 lbslacre
Galleta grass Hilaria jamesii 4 lbslacre

-All poundages are in Pure Live Seed.

-Topsoil will not be used for the construction of tank dikes or any other location
needs. It shall be left in place for use in the final reclamation process.

-Once the reserve pit is dry, it should be filled, recontoured, topsoilspread, and seeded in
the same manner discussed
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Form3160-5 D STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMBNo. 1W4-0135

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ragm Inovenser so,2mo

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTS ON WELLS UTU-78433
Do not use thIs form for proposals to drill or reenter an 6. If Indian, Allotteeor Tribe Name

ÛÛÛ abandoned weH. Use Form 3100-3 (APD) for such proposals. N/A
7. If Unit or CA/Agreement,Nameand/or No.

SUBMITINTRIPLICATE- Other Instructions on toverse elde
N/A

1· Type of Well
Oil Well Gas Well Othe 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name ofOperator Federal 11-21-9-19

Pannonian Energy Inc. (a wholly-owned subsidiary of GASCO ENERGY) 9. APIW 1No.

3a. Address 3b. PhoneNo. (include area code) -047-34608

14 Inyerness Drive E, Ste. H--236, Englewood, CO 80 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or ExploratoryArea

4. LocationofWell(Footage, See.,T.,R.,M., or Survey Description) Riverbend
522' FWL & 577' FNL (NWN½ÿ 11. County or Parish, State

Section 21, T9S-R19E
Uintah County, Utah

12.CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOX(ES)TOINDICATENATUREOFNOTICE,REPORT,OROTHERDATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPE OFACTION

NoticeofIntent Q Acidize O Deepen Q Prodnedon(StadRæume) WaterShut-Off

O Aker Cning Q Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Weß Integrity

O SubsequentReport Q Cuing Repair O New Construction Q Recomplete Other Correct APD Plat

O Change Plans O Plug andAbandon O Temporarily Abandon

O Final AbandonmentNotice O Convertto Weetion Q Plug Back O Water Disposal

13.DesotibePtoposedorCompletedOperations(olearlystateallpertinentdetails,includingestimatedstartingdateof anyproposedworkandapptoximatedurationthereo£
If theproposalis to deependirectionallyor recompletehorizontally,givesubsurfacelocationsandmeasuredandtrueverticaldepthsofall pertinentmarkersandzones.
Attach theBondunderwhichtheworkwillbe performedor providetheBondNo.on filewithBLM/BIARequiredsubsequentrepottsshallbe filedwithin30days
followingcompletionof theinvolvedoperations.If theoperationresults in a multiplecompletionor recomplaionina newinterval,a Fonn3160-4shallbe filedonce
testinghasbeencompleted.FinalAbandonmentNoticesshallbefiledonlyafbr all requirements,includingteclamation,havebeencompleted,and theopetatorhas
determinedthatthesiteisreadyforfmalinspection.

The wrong survey plat was inadvertantly attached to the APD approved 10/21/03. The attached plat, photo's,
and survey information were for an adjacent re-entry location at 599' FWL & 699' FNL. Attached to this
sundry notice are the correct plat, photo's, and survey information for the location at 522' FWL & 57T FNL,
Sec 21, TOS, R19E

14. I hereby certifythatthe foregoingis true and correct
Name (Printed/Typed) Title

Jo L well Operations Manager
Signature Date

February 16 2004
/ / THIS SgACE F .)R FFDgm. OR STATg USE

Approveßy i Title Date
Conditiomof approvat,ifa attached Approvalof thisnoticedoesnot warrantor Office
certifythatthe applicantholaslegalor equitabletitleto thosetigits in the subjectlease

TI e 18U.S.C.Sectionl00i,maËeifa ormieforanypersonknowinglyandwillfullyto maketo anydeparbnentor agencyofthe UnitedStatesany
false,flotitiousor fraudulentstatementsorrepresentationsasto anymatterwithinitsjurisdiction.

(Instructions on reverse)

RECElVED

FEB2 O2004
DIV.0FOlL,GAS &
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PANNONIAN ENERGY, INC.

FEDERAL #11-21-9-19
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 21, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #5 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHEASTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF RECLAIMED ROAD CAMERA ANGLE: SOUTHEASTERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATIONPHOTOs 6 12 0 1 moro
85 South 200 East Vernal, Utah 84078 = =

sley4. 435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com TAKENBY:S11 DRAWNBYK.G. REVISED:
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PANNONIAN ENERGY, INC.
T9S Ri9E SL B.&M* * • • • Well location, FEDERAL #11-21-9-19, located

as shown in the NW 1/4 NW 1/4 of Section
Îa 0 figh.EAST - G.LO. (Basis o/Bearings) gj,";"," 21, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. Uintah County, Utah.
Pire or s,anes 2651.34' - (Measured) Pile ¤/ Stones

BASIS OF ELEVATION

a i SPOT ELEVATIONAT THE NORTHWEST CORNER OF SECTION
21, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE UTELAND BUTTE

522' FËQËÑg /|-2f-9- f9 QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.

(Comp.) ,
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES

Dev. Ungraded Ground = 4763 DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 4749 FEET.

o
o o

21
o o
o o - o

z SCALE

LAND '
CERTIFICATE -

.

THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHAT THE ABOVE PL P PARED FR V.
FIELDNOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS MADEG.Y Obl .

SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME ARE T THE

LOT 2 LOT 1

BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND

REVISED: 11-19-01 D.COX STATE OF UTAH

EAST - 42.50 (G.L.O.) * 4 UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078

(435) 789-1017

SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:

LEGEND: 1" = 1000' 6-2-01 6-11-01
PARTY REFERENCES

=
90° SYMBOL D.A. P.M. D.COX G.L.O. PLAT

& = PROPOSED WELL HEAD. LATITUDE = 40 01'19" WEATHER FILE

A = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED, LONGITUDE = 109 47'32" WARM PANNONIAN ENERGY,
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PANNONIAN ENERGY, INC. m:7,

LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

FEDERAL #11-21--9-19
SECTION 21, T9S, R19E, S.L,8.&M.

577' FNL 522' FWL

Proposed Access

C-2.6'
663

Sto. JJ
SCALE: 1 = 50

DATE: 11--19-01

DRAWN BY: D.COX APPROX. s

TOP OF - f.Û' •

CUT SLOPE B. 62 J· R 57.5'

(O

Flore y
Pit 4

IIIIII

PIPE RACKS

C-4.0 I I

E 64.7 L .

c S. 62. 9'

32' DOG HOUSE 120'
i

Sto. 1+50

RESERVE ¯¯ r 7 o*
---- PITS --- 4. 2 ' ¯ / • J,

(10' Deep) ----
64.9

B. 52.8

L
PUMP

MUD SHED TOILET

HOPPER

POWER

TOOLS ÑOund Corners O
OX

B. 71.7· as Needed F/LL SLOPE

Otm 8

E 6
ST AGE

Sta. 0+00

C-5.9' E-9.6'
B. 66.6'

B. 51.1'

Dev. Ungraded Ground at Location Stoke = 4762.9'760.7> NTAH ENGINEERINc & LAND SURVEYINC

Dev Graded Ground at Location Stoke = 4 85 So. 200 East * Vemal, UtaA 84078 • (435)
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PANNONIAN ENERGY, INC.

x-section TYPICAL CROSS SECTION FOR

scale FEDERAL #11-21-9-19

1" -

o. SECTION 21, T9S, Ri9E, S.L.B.&M

DATE: 11-19---01 577' FNL 522' FWL
DRAWN BY: D.COX

Preconstruction
Grade 32' 120'

S TA. J+ 15

, 60' 32' 120'
10 -

LOCAT/0N STA/Œ

0-- 60 32' 120'

Slope= 1 1/2: 1

inished Grade (IPP-À

32 120

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES EXCESS MATERIALAFTER

CUT
5% COMPACTION = 1,960 Cu. Yds.

(6") Topsoil Stripping = 1,070 Cu. Yds. Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 1,960 Cu. Yds.

(1/2 Pit Vol.)
Remainirg Location = 5,820 Cu. Yds.

EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu, Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 6,890 CU.YDS. (After Rehobilitation)

FILL = 4,680 CU.YDS. UINTAH ENCINEERING & LAND SURVEYING
86 So. 200 East * Vernal, Utah. 84078 * (435)
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MY FON 19.2 MI. +I-
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SCALE:1: 100,0 DRAWNBY:K.G. REVISED:11-13-01
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LEGEND: PANNONION ENERGY, INC.
------ --- PROPOSEDACCESSROAD N FEDERAL#ll-21-9-19

EXISTING ROAD SECTION 21, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.&M.
577 FNL 522' FWL
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PROPOSED LOC4T10N:
FEDERAL #11-21-9-19

LEGEND: PANNONION ENERGY, INC.
pf DISPOSAL WELLS WATER WELLS N FEDERAL #11-21-9-19
e PRODUCING WELLS ABANDONED WELLS SECTION 21, T9S, R19E, S.L.B.& M.

SHUT IN WELLS -g- TEMPORARILY ABANDONEo 577' FNL 522'
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STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name:
API number:
Location:
Company that filed original application:
Date original permit was issued:
Company that permit was issued to:

Ched Desired Action:one

Transfer pending (unapproved) Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drillon the property, hereby verifies thatthe information as
submitted in the pending Application for Permit to Drill,remains valid and does not require revision. The new
owner of the application accepts and agrees to the information and procedures as stated in the application.

L/ Transfer approved Application for Permit to Drill to new operator

The undersigned as owner with legal rights to drillon the property as permitted, hereby verifies that the
inforruation as submitted in the previously approved application to drill, remains valid and does not require
revision.

Following is a checklist of some items related to the application, which should be verified. Yes No

If located on private land, has theownership char ged?

Ifso, has the surface agreement been updated?

Have any wells been drilled in thevicinityof the proposed well which would affect the spacing or siting
requirements for this location?
Have there been any unit or other agreements put in place that could affect the permitting or operation of this
proposed well?
Have there been any changes to the access route including ownership or right-of-way,which could affect the
proposed location?

Has the approved source of water for drillingchanged?

Have there been any physical changes to the surface location or access route which willrequire a change in
plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?

Is bonding still in place, which covers thisproposed well? Bond No. /Ñ SS

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drill that is being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill,Form 3, as appropriate, with
n cessaryaseppp r

ee

Representing (company name) V L DIV.0FOIL,GASE MINING
The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for
Permit to Drill.

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS AND MINING

Request to Transfer Application or Permit to Drill

(This form should accompany a Sundry Notice, Form 9, requesting APD transfer)

Well name:
API number:
Location:
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plans from what was discussed at the onsite evaluation?

Is bonding still in place, which covers thisproposed well? Bond No. /Ñ SS

Any desired or necessary changes to either a pending or approved Application for Permit to Drill that is being transferred,
should be filed on a Sundry Notice, Form 9, or amended Application for Permit to Drill,Form 3, as appropriate, with
n cessaryaseppp r

ee

Representing (company name) V L DIV.0FOIL,GASE MINING
The person signing this form must have legal authority to represent the company or individual(s) to be listed as the new operator on the Application for
Permit to Drill.



O O
STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do not use thisform for proposals to drillnew wells,sîgnificantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to
drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL M OTHER see attached list
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER'
Gasco Production Company gg§ ¶f

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
114 Inverness Dr. Eastern Englewood STATE ZIP80112 (303) 483-0044

4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUfflY

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

NOTICE OF INTENT
ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will stai CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of woriccompletion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCINGFORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER- name change
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Pannonian Energy, Inc. changed its name to Gasco Production Company effective February 24, 2004

RECEIVED

APR22 2004
DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING

NAME(PLEASE PRI ). Chou TITLE Land Manager

SIGNATURE DATE

(This space for State use only)

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse
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O Opivision of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH

3. FILE
Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/24/2004
FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N1815-Pannonian Energy, Inc. N2575-Gasco Production Company

114 Inverness Dr E 114 Inverness Dr E
Englewood, CO 80112 Englewood, CO 80112

Phone: 1-(303) 483-0044 Phone: 1-(303) 483-0044

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S 150E 4301332391 t/ 13787 State GW DRL C
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 State GW APD
WILKIN RIDGE STATE 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 / 14033 State GW DRL C
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 State GW NEW C

FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 47
'

13601 Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 Federal GW APD
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 Federal GW APD C
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 Federal GW APD C
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 / 13640 Federal GW P
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 -

, Federal GW APD C
e FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734111 | 13441 Federal GW P
e FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 | 13455 Federal GW P

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 Federal GW APD C
, FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 g/ 13641 Federal GW P
• FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 Federal GW NEW C

FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 Federal GW APD C
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 06 100S 190E 4304734813 Federal GW LA C
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 Federal GW APD C

e LAFKAS FED 1-3 03 110S 200E 4304731178 / 1367 Federal GW S
e WILLOW CREEK UNIT 2 05 110S 200E 4304731818 / 11604 Federal GW TA
, HILL FEDERAL 1-10 10 110S 200E 4304731026 1368 Federal GW TA

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/22/2004

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/22/2004

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 4/21/2004

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: ***

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: *** 4/21/2004

Gasco Prod Pannonian FORM 4B.xis
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Gasco Prod Pannonian FORM 4B.xis



O O
6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM in process BIA

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: in process

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/29/2004

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/29/2004

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: n/a

6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: 4/22/2004

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 4127764

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 4127759

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 4127765

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number n/a

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: N/A

COMMENTS:
This is a corporate name change withinthe same corporation and it's subsidiaries

Gasco Prod Pannonian FORM 4B.xis
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WELLNAME API # LOCATION COUNTY Status¯
Federal 23-29 #1 43-047-34111 NESW,Sec. 29, T98, R19E UtntahFederal 42-29-9-19 43-047-34202 SENE, Sec. 29. TOS,Ri9E UIntah PLythamFederal 22-22-9-19 43·447-34607 SENW,Sec. 22, TSS. R19E Uintah PFederal 32-31- 19 4&O47,34201 SWNE Sec. 31, TOS,R19E Uintah P

WilkinRidge State 12-32-10-17 43-013-32447 SWNW,Sec, 32, T10S Ri7E Duchesne DRLWillowCreek#2 43-047-31818 SESW, Sec. 5, T11S, ft20E Uintah TAHillFederal #1-10 43-047-31026 NESW,Sec. 10, T118, R20E Uintah TAFederal23-21-0-19 43-047-34199 NESW,Sec. 21, TOS,Ri9E UintahFederal 43-30-9-19 4 047-36343 NESE, Sec. 30 TOS,Ri9E Uintah APD
Federal 11-21-9-19 43-047-34606 NWNW,Sec. 21, TOS,RieE UIntah APDFederal 11-22-0-19 43-047-35404 NWNW,Sec. 22, TOS,R19E UIntah APDFederal 22-30-10-18 43-047-34924 SENW,Sec. 30, T108,Ri8E Uintah APDState 24-16-9-19 43-047-35588 SESW, Sec. 16, Tes, R19E Uintah NEWLafkas Federal 1-3 43-0473-31178 SWSW, Sec. 3, T11S, R20E Uintah 8Federal 21-6-9-19 434)47-34813 NENW,Sec. 6,T9S,R19E Uintah APDFederal 42-21-9-19 43-047-35405 SENE, Sec. 21, TOS,R19E Uintah APDFederal 31-21-9-19 43-047-35606 NWNE, Sec. 21, TSS, R19E UIntah APDFederal 41-31-9-19 43-047-35624 NENE, Sec. 31, T98, R19E Uintah ARDFederal 24-3141-19 434)47-36623 SESW, Sec. 31, T9S, R19E Ulrdah NEWWilkinRidge Federal 34-17-10-17 43-013-32560 SWSE, Sec. 17, T10S,R17E Duchesne APD

O

RECEIVED
APR3 0 2@4Div.0F 0/I.,GAS&

WELLNAME API # LOCATION COUNTY Status¯
Federal 23-29 #1 43-047-34111 NESW,Sec. 29, T98, R19E UtntahFederal 42-29-9-19 43-047-34202 SENE, Sec. 29. TOS,Ri9E UIntah PLythamFederal 22-22-9-19 43·447-34607 SENW,Sec. 22, TSS. R19E Uintah PFederal 32-31- 19 4&O47,34201 SWNE Sec. 31, TOS,R19E Uintah P

WilkinRidge State 12-32-10-17 43-013-32447 SWNW,Sec, 32, T10S Ri7E Duchesne DRLWillowCreek#2 43-047-31818 SESW, Sec. 5, T11S, ft20E Uintah TAHillFederal #1-10 43-047-31026 NESW,Sec. 10, T118, R20E Uintah TAFederal23-21-0-19 43-047-34199 NESW,Sec. 21, TOS,Ri9E Uintah
Federal 43-30-9-19 4 047-36343 NESE, Sec. 30 TOS,Ri9E Uintah APD
Federal 11-21-9-19 43-047-34606 NWNW,Sec. 21, TOS,RieE UIntah APDFederal 11-22-0-19 43-047-35404 NWNW,Sec. 22, TOS,R19E UIntah APDFederal 22-30-10-18 43-047-34924 SENW,Sec. 30, T108,Ri8E Uintah APDState 24-16-9-19 43-047-35588 SESW, Sec. 16, Tes, R19E Uintah NEWLafkas Federal 1-3 43-0473-31178 SWSW, Sec. 3, T11S, R20E Uintah 8Federal 21-6-9-19 434)47-34813 NENW,Sec. 6,T9S,R19E Uintah APDFederal 42-21-9-19 43-047-35405 SENE, Sec. 21, TOS,R19E Uintah APDFederal 31-21-9-19 43-047-35606 NWNE, Sec. 21, TSS, R19E UIntah APDFederal 41-31-9-19 43-047-35624 NENE, Sec. 31, T98, R19E Uintah ARDFederal 24-3141-19 434)47-36623 SESW, Sec. 31, T9S, R19E Ulrdah NEWWilkinRidge Federal 34-17-10-17 43-013-32560 SWSE, Sec. 17, T10S,R17E Duchesne APD

O

RECEIVED
APR3 0 2@4Div.0F 0/I.,GAS&
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STATEOFUTAN FORMS
DE XFMarr OF MTURAI. RESOURCES

ÿ gg DIVISIONOF OIL,GASANDMINING

ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator. Gasco ProductionCo.(FormerlyPannonlan Energy) Operator AccountNumbec N25 7
Address. 14 invemess Dr. E. Sulle H-236

Englewood

CO g¡p 80112 (303) 48MIO44

WeH i
API Minnbar 90 See Twp Rng . County .

4304734169 Federal44-2(MI-19 SESE 20 98 19E Uinlah

Aouen come t NewEntity Sjmå Data Eddty Assignment
Númber Nun er EA A 00W

conunennuNewWen TVINCS

Well2
À$1NMäber WenName QQ Twp ng DObrdg

4304734168 Federal 24-20-9-19 SESW 20 98 19E Uintah

ÁnndaGode Cuéent Endty New EnSty pÑ ato AUtWAIGnmó t
laaber Number WWadBvaDeth

A 4/26/2004

comments:NewWeR

Wet 3
$¾aber Wei Name QQ JWg täd

3204734008 Federal 11-21-9-19 NWNW 21 9S 19E Uintah

ÀbtÉhkode uiÑIÑLElidly NewEntitÿ hele
r Num BibHRDA

qq A 16/ 004 5 /p
com.n.nt.: gy

RECEIV D
NA 04 2004

ACTIONCODES:
A - Estabish newentKyfor newwel (singlewel only) Diyny og

B - Add newwoi to existingentRy(groupor unitwei)
MIMNG

C - Re·aesign wei Rom oneexistingen!Ryto anotherexistingenity

D - Re·assign wel fromone existingentKyto a new endly
E - Other (Explainin 'commenis'section)

TRle Dale

MAY 04 2004 2:49PM HP LASERJET 3200 p.2

STATEOFUTAN FORMS
DE XFMarr OF MTURAI. RESOURCES

ÿ gg DIVISIONOF OIL,GASANDMINING

ENTITYACTIONFORM

Operator. Gasco ProductionCo.(FormerlyPannonlan Energy) Operator AccountNumbec N25 7
Address. 14 invemess Dr. E. Sulle H-236

Englewood

CO g¡p 80112 (303) 48MIO44

WeH i
API Minnbar 90 See Twp Rng . County .

4304734169 Federal44-2(MI-19 SESE 20 98 19E Uinlah

Aouen come t NewEntity Sjmå Data Eddty Assignment
Númber Nun er EA A 00W

conunennuNewWen TVINCS

Well2
À$1NMäber WenName QQ Twp ng DObrdg

4304734168 Federal 24-20-9-19 SESW 20 98 19E Uintah

ÁnndaGode Cuéent Endty New EnSty pÑ ato AUtWAIGnmó t
laaber Number WWadBvaDeth

A 4/26/2004

comments:NewWeR

Wet 3
$¾aber Wei Name QQ JWg täd

3204734008 Federal 11-21-9-19 NWNW 21 9S 19E Uintah

ÀbtÉhkode uiÑIÑLElidly NewEntitÿ hele
r Num BibHRDA

qq A 16/ 004 5 /p
com.n.nt.: gy

RECEIV D
NA 04 2004

ACTIONCODES:
A - Estabish newentKyfor newwel (singlewel only) Diyny og

B - Add newwoi to existingentRy(groupor unitwei)
MIMNG

C - Re·aesign wei Rom oneexistingen!Ryto anotherexistingenity

D - Re·assign wel fromone existingentKyto a new endly
E - Other (Explainin 'commenis'section)

TRle Dale



co ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19

Û$ V24/f 3 ÿ60 8 NE/NW Sec. 21, T95, R19E
Uintah County, Utah

DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

4/7/04 Huffman Enterprises building rd into loc. (SCE)

4/12/04 Rd work 90% finished. MI D-8 cat to build loc. (SCE)

4/15/04 Loc finished and still working on reserve pit. Haven't had to blast to build loc. (SCE)

4/20/04 Finishing loc and pit today. Had to blast bottom of pit to get deep enough. (SCE)

4/23/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout rathole rig. Spudded well 9:00 AM 4/22/04. Ran 17 ¼'
hammer bit and air/foam drilled to conductor TD 230'. SDFN. (SCE)

4/24/04 RIH w/ guide shoe + 5 jts 13 3/8" 54.5# ST&C csg, to 223' GL. RU Halliburton.
cmt'ed csg back to surface w/ 210 sx Class "A" regular cmt. Approx 10 bbls cmt
returns to pit. SWIFN to let cmt set.

4/25/04 RIH w/ 12 ¼" bit. Pre drilled hole to 805'. Drilled rat and mouse hole. RDMOL. (SCE)

5/8/04 Start moving Nabors rig 924 to location.

5/8/04 thru 5/11/04 Contiue moving rig 924 and rigging up same.

5/12/04 Raised Derrick, rig totally on location. Replaced both shale shakers with rebuilt matching
linear shakers. Rebuild choke manifold and replace worn out parts.
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7-as a tw / e GASCO ENERGYys-og- 3¥bd 8 DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 Date: 5/13/2004 Days: 0

Depth: 600' Prog: OPR: RIG UP |Formation:

DMC: $ TMC: $ TDC: $ $ 173,083 CWC: $ $ 173,083

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: IV-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ 99,265

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ 1,361

PVlYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 65,450

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 3,532

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 800

Chls: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,850

Time Break Dovn: RPM: Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $ 173,083

6:00 6:00 24:00 RIG UP cum.wtr: $ 3,532

Cum. Fuel

START TO DRILL @6:00 AM5/13/04 Cum. Bits:

Rot. Hrs:

TRIP GAS

CONN

BKG GAS

7-as a tw / e GASCO ENERGYys-og- 3¥bd 8 DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 Date: 5/13/2004 Days: 0

Depth: 600' Prog: OPR: RIG UP |Formation:

DMC: $ TMC: $ TDC: $ $ 173,083 CWC: $ $ 173,083

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: IV-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE
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43 o¥p-3¥&oeg GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

0 11
Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: Date: 5/14/2004 Days: 1

Depth: 876' Prog: 220 D Hrs: 3 AV ROP: 73 Formation:

DMC: $ TMC: $ TDC: $ $ 24,825 CWC: $ $ 197,908

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: water Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 1 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: 15998 Surf. Csg: $ - Location: $ -

PVlYP: SPM: Size: 12 1/4 Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: MFG: J-Z Prod Csg: $ - BHA: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: HTJ-537 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: Jets: 20-Mar Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: In: 656 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 8,000

Solids: FTG: 220 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,000

Chls: Hrs: 3 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ -

PflMf: FPH: 73 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: 25 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,000

Time Break Dos «n: RPM: Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 3,000

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $24,825

6:00 15:00 9:00 RIG UP cum.wtr: $ 3,552

15:00 19:00 4:00 PICK UP BHA Cum. Fuel

19:00 2:00 7:00 WASH F/315' T/656' - TD FROM AIR RIG Cum. Bits: $ 8,000

2:00 2:30 0:30 DRLG. F/656' Tl730' Rot. Hrs: 3

2:30 3:30 1:00 SURVEY @670' 1 Deg.

3:30 6:00 2:30 DRLG. F/730' T/876'

P/U LITH: TRIP GAS

S/O CONN

ROT. BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK

43 o¥p-3¥&oeg GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

0 11
Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: Date: 5/14/2004 Days: 1
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3-o 9-34/ag GASCO ENERGY
Y DAILY DRILLINGANDCOMPLETIONREPORT

11 2
Well: FED. u-2‡·9-19OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/15/2004 Days: 2

Depth: 1925' Prog: 1049 D Hrs: 22.6 AVROP: 46 6 Formation:

DMC: $ 2247 TMC:$ 2247 TOC $ $ 30 015 CWC: $ $ 227,923

Contractor: Nai ors # 924 Mud Co: M4 TANGIBLE INTANotBLE

MW: Water t.Iner: 6 1/2 Bit#: 1 conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 alN: 1599ß Surt Osg: $ - Locatîon: $ -

PVlYP SPM: 200 Size: 12 1/4 Int Cag: $ - RigCost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: 2100 MFG: J-Z Prod Ösg: $ - Fuel: $ 11,248

ph: GPMi 860 Type: HTJ-537 Float Equp: $ - cement: $ -

WL: RY: 300 Jets: 20-Mar Well Head: # - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: Av: 146/163 in: 656° TBGIRods; $ - water: $ -

Sand: Dev: a @it73 Out: Packers; $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Sonds: Dev: 3/4 @1738 FTG: 1209 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1 000

Chis: Hva: 25 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPR: 49 76 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ $25

Dapp ppb: TIBIG Purnping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2 247

ca: WOB: 45 Pame Mover: $ - Mise, I Labor; $ 610

Time Break DOl.*B: RPM: 80/135 Mise: $ - Mud Motors: # (000

START END TIME SMA: 838' Dany Totalt S - Dany Total: $30015

6:00 6:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.wtr: $ 3,552

6:30 15:30 9:00 DRLG. F/876' Tl1206' 330' 36.7 fph ( DRLG.With 1 Pump) cum.Fuet $ 11,248

15:30 16:00 0:30 SURVEY @1173' 0 Deg. cum.Bits: 5 (00û

16:00 2:30 10:30 DRLG, F/1206' T/1785' 579' 55.1 fph Rot Mrs:

2:30 3:00 0:30 SURVEY @ 1736' 3/4 Deg.

3:00 6:00 3:00 DRLG,Fli786' T/1925' 140' 46.7 fph

PIU LITH: TRíP GAS

SIO

3-o 9-34/ag GASCO ENERGY
Y DAILY DRILLINGANDCOMPLETIONREPORT

11 2
Well: FED. u-2‡·9-19OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/15/2004 Days: 2

Depth: 1925' Prog: 1049 D Hrs: 22.6 AVROP: 46 6 Formation:
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Gel: Press: 2100 MFG: J-Z Prod Ösg: $ - Fuel: $ 11,248

ph: GPMi 860 Type: HTJ-537 Float Equp: $ - cement: $ -

WL: RY: 300 Jets: 20-Mar Well Head: # - Mud Logger: $ -
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Chis: Hva: 25 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85
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6:30 15:30 9:00 DRLG. F/876' Tl1206' 330' 36.7 fph ( DRLG.With 1 Pump) cum.Fuet $ 11,248
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2:30 3:00 0:30 SURVEY @ 1736' 3/4 Deg.

3:00 6:00 3:00 DRLG,Fli786' T/1925' 140' 46.7 fph

PIU LITH: TRíP GAS

SIO



C op-3¾at GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGANDCOMPLETIONREPORT

Well: FED. ††-21-9-19 OPR: ORLG. Date: 5/16/2004 Days: 3

Depth 3134' Prog: 1209 D Hrs: 22 1/2 AVROP: 531 Formation: surface

DMC; $1/69 TMC: $3,710 TDC: $14351 CWC: $247,274

Contractor: Na örs #924 Mad Co: M4 TANGIBLE lÑTANGIBLE

MW: Water Uneri 61/2 Bit #: 1 Conductor Rig Mova $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: 1599& Surf. Osg: $ - Locatiom $ -

PVIYP: SPM: 200 Size: 12 4/4 int Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Geh Press: 2100 MFGT J-Z Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 8 O Type: HTJ 53T Fioat Equp $ - Gement $ -

WL:. NY: 300 Jets: 3 / 15s WenHead: $ - Med Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 146/163 in: 56 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 2175 Out Packers; $ - Bits i Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: 1 2677 FTG: 2478 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools¾ $ 1,000

Ch!»: His: 48 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: 5t6 Heater; $ Consultant $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIO: Pumping LIT $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1;469

Ca: WOB: 45/50 Prime Mover: $ - Wac. I Labor: $ $72

Timt Break DOVD: RPM: 80/130 Mise: $ - Mud Motors: $ 3,000

START END TIME BHA: panyTotal: S - Daily Totah $19,351

6:00 11:30 5:30 DRLG. F/1925°T/2207' 282' 51.31ph cum.wtr: 8 3;552

11:30 12:00 0:30 SURVEY @2175' 1 Deg. Cum. Puei 5 11,248

12:00 17:30 5:30 DRLG.FI220T T/2538' 331' 60 2 fph Cum, sust 4 8,000

17:30 18:00 0;30 RIG SERVICE Rot Mrs: 46

18:00 21:30 3$0 DRLG. F/2538' Tl2727' 189' 541ph

21:30 22:00 0;30 SURVEY@267T 1 Dag
22100 6:00 8

PIU UTH: TRIP GAS

SIÖ

C op-3¾at GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGANDCOMPLETIONREPORT

Well: FED. ††-21-9-19 OPR: ORLG. Date: 5/16/2004 Days: 3

Depth 3134' Prog: 1209 D Hrs: 22 1/2 AVROP: 531 Formation: surface

DMC; $1/69 TMC: $3,710 TDC: $14351 CWC: $247,274

Contractor: Na örs #924 Mad Co: M4 TANGIBLE lÑTANGIBLE

MW: Water Uneri 61/2 Bit #: 1 Conductor Rig Mova $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: 1599& Surf. Osg: $ - Locatiom $ -

PVIYP: SPM: 200 Size: 12 4/4 int Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Geh Press: 2100 MFGT J-Z Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 8 O Type: HTJ 53T Fioat Equp $ - Gement $ -

WL:. NY: 300 Jets: 3 / 15s WenHead: $ - Med Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 146/163 in: 56 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 2175 Out Packers; $ - Bits i Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: 1 2677 FTG: 2478 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools¾ $ 1,000

Ch!»: His: 48 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: 5t6 Heater; $ Consultant $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIO: Pumping LIT $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1;469

Ca: WOB: 45/50 Prime Mover: $ - Wac. I Labor: $ $72

Timt Break DOVD: RPM: 80/130 Mise: $ - Mud Motors: $ 3,000

START END TIME BHA: panyTotal: S - Daily Totah $19,351

6:00 11:30 5:30 DRLG. F/1925°T/2207' 282' 51.31ph cum.wtr: 8 3;552

11:30 12:00 0:30 SURVEY @2175' 1 Deg. Cum. Puei 5 11,248

12:00 17:30 5:30 DRLG.FI220T T/2538' 331' 60 2 fph Cum, sust 4 8,000

17:30 18:00 0;30 RIG SERVICE Rot Mrs: 46

18:00 21:30 3$0 DRLG. F/2538' Tl2727' 189' 541ph

21:30 22:00 0;30 SURVEY@267T 1 Dag
22100 6:00 8

PIU UTH: TRIP GAS

SIÖ



ty'yowaWr?' GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILUNGANDCOMPLETIONREPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: Fishing Date: 5/17/2004 Days: 4

Depth: 3497 Prog: 363 D Hrs: 12 1/2 AVROP 29 Formation: sudace

DMC: $812 TMC: $4528 TDC: $11,507 CWCi $264181
Contractor: Nabors #924 Mud Co: M-1 TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Water Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #t 1 Conductor: Rig Move: S -

VIS: Strokei 10 SIN 15998 Suit Osg $ - Trucking: $ 390

PVNP: SPM: 200 Size: 12 1/4 tot Cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Geh Presa: 2100 MFG: J Prod Osgl $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 860 Type: HTJ-537 Float Equp: $ - Cement $ -

WL: NY: 300 Jets 3 / 15s Wen Head; $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 146/163 in 656 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 395

Sand: Dev: 1 1/4 3155' Out: Packers: $ - Bits | Corehead: $ -

Gouds: Dev: FTGi 2841 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chis: Hrs: 60 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: gg5 Heater: $ - Consultant: É 8Ž5

Dapp ppb: TTBIG Pumping LIT: $ - DrdRngMud: $ 832

Ca: WOB: 45 Prime Mover; $ - Misc. I Labor $ -

Tkne Break DO¾ m: RPM: 80/130 Mise: $ - Med Motors' 000

START END TIME BHA: DanyTotak $ - Daily Totah $17,507

6:00 8:00 2:00 DRLGLF/3134' T/3198* 64* 32 fph cum.wtr: $ 3,552

8:00 8:30 0:30 SURVEY @ 3155' i 1/4 Deÿ cum.Fuel $ 11;248

8:30 14 00 5:30 DRLG, FI3198' T/3354' 156' 28 4 fph cum.sits: $ $000

14:00 14:30 0:30 RíG SERV1CE Rot. Hra:

14:30 19:30 5:00 DRLG.FI3354' T/3497' 143' 28.6 fph

19:30 20:00 0:30 PULLED THREADS OFF PIN INTOOL JT. @ 1846'

20:00 23:30 3:30 TRIP OUT FOR FISHING TOOLS

23:30 3:00 3:30 PICK UP 10 5/8 OVERSHOTWITH6 1/8 GRAPPLE - BUMPER SUB - JAR &A6 1/4DC

3:00 6:00 3:00 TRIP IN (CHECKALL TOOL JTS.) & BREAK CIRC, @ 1840'

P10 LITH: TRIP GAS

SIO CONN

ROT. BKG GAS
S.LSEELY PEAK

ty'yowaWr?' GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILUNGANDCOMPLETIONREPORT
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DMC: $812 TMC: $4528 TDC: $11,507 CWCi $264181
Contractor: Nabors #924 Mud Co: M-1 TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Water Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #t 1 Conductor: Rig Move: S -

VIS: Strokei 10 SIN 15998 Suit Osg $ - Trucking: $ 390

PVNP: SPM: 200 Size: 12 1/4 tot Cag: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Geh Presa: 2100 MFG: J Prod Osgl $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 860 Type: HTJ-537 Float Equp: $ - Cement $ -

WL: NY: 300 Jets 3 / 15s Wen Head; $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 146/163 in 656 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 395

Sand: Dev: 1 1/4 3155' Out: Packers: $ - Bits | Corehead: $ -

Gouds: Dev: FTGi 2841 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chis: Hrs: 60 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: gg5 Heater: $ - Consultant: É 8Ž5

Dapp ppb: TTBIG Pumping LIT: $ - DrdRngMud: $ 832

Ca: WOB: 45 Prime Mover; $ - Misc. I Labor $ -

Tkne Break DO¾ m: RPM: 80/130 Mise: $ - Med Motors' 000

START END TIME BHA: DanyTotak $ - Daily Totah $17,507

6:00 8:00 2:00 DRLGLF/3134' T/3198* 64* 32 fph cum.wtr: $ 3,552

8:00 8:30 0:30 SURVEY @ 3155' i 1/4 Deÿ cum.Fuel $ 11;248

8:30 14 00 5:30 DRLG, FI3198' T/3354' 156' 28 4 fph cum.sits: $ $000

14:00 14:30 0:30 RíG SERV1CE Rot. Hra:

14:30 19:30 5:00 DRLG.FI3354' T/3497' 143' 28.6 fph

19:30 20:00 0:30 PULLED THREADS OFF PIN INTOOL JT. @ 1846'

20:00 23:30 3:30 TRIP OUT FOR FISHING TOOLS

23:30 3:00 3:30 PICK UP 10 5/8 OVERSHOTWITH6 1/8 GRAPPLE - BUMPER SUB - JAR &A6 1/4DC

3:00 6:00 3:00 TRIP IN (CHECKALL TOOL JTS.) & BREAK CIRC, @ 1840'

P10 LITH: TRIP GAS

SIO CONN

ROT. BKG GAS
S.LSEELY PEAK



¥3-off-sy&g GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

015
Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP IN WITH BIT# 2 Date: 5/18/2004 Days: 5

Depth: 3497' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0 Formation: surface

DMC: $740 TMC: $5,268 TDC: $26,450 CWC: $291,231

Contractor: Nal ors #924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Water Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 1 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 s/N: 15998 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: SPM: 200 Size: 12 1/4 Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: 2100 MFG: J-Z Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 860 Type: HTJ-537 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 300 Jets: 3 / 15s Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 146/163 in: 656 TBGlRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 1/4 3155 Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: FTG: 2841 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chis: Hrs: 60 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: 46.95 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: 7/F/1/4" Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 740

Ca: WOB: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ 9,800

Tim¢ Break Dovn: RPM: 80/130 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 3,000

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $26,450

6:00 7:30 1:30 ATTEMPT TO MILL OVER SWELLED DP BOX @ 1840' WITH cum.wtr: $ 3,552

6 1/8" GUIDE cum.Fuel $ 11,248

7:30 8:30 1:00 TRIP OUT cum.Bits: $ 8,000

8:30 9:30 1:00 CHANGED FISHING TOOLS TO 6 1/4" GUIDE Rot. Hrs:

9:30 10:30 1:00 TRIP IN AND LATCHED ON TO FISH

10:30 12:00 1:30 WORKED FISH FREE

12:00 13:30 1:30 TRIP OUT TO FISH

13:30 15:00 1:30 LAY DOWN FISHING TOOLS

15:00 2:30 11:30 TRIP OUT WET LAY DOWN 5 MORE JTS. WITH SWELLED TOOL JTS. - LAY DOWN MOTOR

AND STABS.

2:30 4:30 2:00 UNPLUG DCs (SAND)

4:30 6:00 1:30 TRIP IN TO DRILL WITH BIT #2

P/U LITH: TRIP GAS

S/O CONN

ROT. BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK

¥3-off-sy&g GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

015
Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP IN WITH BIT# 2 Date: 5/18/2004 Days: 5

Depth: 3497' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0 Formation: surface

DMC: $740 TMC: $5,268 TDC: $26,450 CWC: $291,231

Contractor: Nal ors #924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Water Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 1 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 s/N: 15998 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: SPM: 200 Size: 12 1/4 Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: 2100 MFG: J-Z Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 860 Type: HTJ-537 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 300 Jets: 3 / 15s Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 146/163 in: 656 TBGlRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 1/4 3155 Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: FTG: 2841 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chis: Hrs: 60 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: 46.95 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: 7/F/1/4" Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 740

Ca: WOB: 45 Prime Mover: $ - Fishing: $ 9,800

Tim¢ Break Dovn: RPM: 80/130 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 3,000

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $26,450

6:00 7:30 1:30 ATTEMPT TO MILL OVER SWELLED DP BOX @ 1840' WITH cum.wtr: $ 3,552

6 1/8" GUIDE cum.Fuel $ 11,248

7:30 8:30 1:00 TRIP OUT cum.Bits: $ 8,000

8:30 9:30 1:00 CHANGED FISHING TOOLS TO 6 1/4" GUIDE Rot. Hrs:

9:30 10:30 1:00 TRIP IN AND LATCHED ON TO FISH

10:30 12:00 1:30 WORKED FISH FREE

12:00 13:30 1:30 TRIP OUT TO FISH

13:30 15:00 1:30 LAY DOWN FISHING TOOLS

15:00 2:30 11:30 TRIP OUT WET LAY DOWN 5 MORE JTS. WITH SWELLED TOOL JTS. - LAY DOWN MOTOR

AND STABS.

2:30 4:30 2:00 UNPLUG DCs (SAND)

4:30 6:00 1:30 TRIP IN TO DRILL WITH BIT #2

P/U LITH: TRIP GAS

S/O CONN

ROT. BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK



aes RRE GASCO ENERGY
3-OVŸ-9 DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT0 16

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP OUT TO RUN CSG. Date: 5/19/2004 Days: 6

Depth: 3520' Prog: 23 D Hrs: 1 1/2 AV ROP: 15.3 Formation: surface
DMC: $749 TMC: $6,017 TDC: $39,447 CWC: $330,678

Contractor: Nat ors #924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Water Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: 15998 KA4512 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: SPM: 200 Size: 12 1/4 12 1/2 Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: 2100 MFG: J-Z REED Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 860 Type: HTJ-537 HP 53 A Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 300 Jets: 3 / 15s 3 X 24 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 146/163 In: 656 3497 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 14,575

Sand: Dev: Out: 3497 3520 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 8,000

Solids: Dev: FTG: 2841 23 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chls: Hrs: 60 1/2 1 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: 46.95 15.3 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: 7/F/1/4" Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 749

Ca: WOB: 45 40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 3,213

Time Break Down: RPM: 80/130 65 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $39,447

6:00 21:30 15:30 TRIP IN - BREAK EVERYJT. - LAYDOWN 7 JTS. (SWELLED BOX) cum.wtr: $ 18,522

HAD TO HEATTOOL JTS. TO BREAK THEM Cum. Fuel $ 11,248

21:30 22:30 1:00 BREAK CIRC. cum.sits: $ 16,000

22:30 0:30 2:00 WASH & REAM F/3290' T/3497' Rot. Hrs: 62

0:30 2:00 1:30 DRLG. F/3497' T/3520'

2:00 3:30 1:30 CIRC. &PUMP SWEEPS

3:00 6:00 3:00 TRIP OUT TO RUN 8 5/8" CSG.

P/U LITH: TRIP GAS

S/O CONN

ROT. BKG GAS

S.L.SEELY PEAK

aes RRE GASCO ENERGY
3-OVŸ-9 DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT0 16

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP OUT TO RUN CSG. Date: 5/19/2004 Days: 6

Depth: 3520' Prog: 23 D Hrs: 1 1/2 AV ROP: 15.3 Formation: surface
DMC: $749 TMC: $6,017 TDC: $39,447 CWC: $330,678

Contractor: Nat ors #924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Water Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 1 2 Conductor: Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: 15998 KA4512 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: SPM: 200 Size: 12 1/4 12 1/2 Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: 2100 MFG: J-Z REED Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 860 Type: HTJ-537 HP 53 A Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 300 Jets: 3 / 15s 3 X 24 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 146/163 In: 656 3497 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 14,575

Sand: Dev: Out: 3497 3520 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 8,000

Solids: Dev: FTG: 2841 23 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chls: Hrs: 60 1/2 1 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: 46.95 15.3 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: 7/F/1/4" Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 749

Ca: WOB: 45 40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 3,213

Time Break Down: RPM: 80/130 65 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $ - Daily Total: $39,447

6:00 21:30 15:30 TRIP IN - BREAK EVERYJT. - LAYDOWN 7 JTS. (SWELLED BOX) cum.wtr: $ 18,522

HAD TO HEATTOOL JTS. TO BREAK THEM Cum. Fuel $ 11,248

21:30 22:30 1:00 BREAK CIRC. cum.sits: $ 16,000

22:30 0:30 2:00 WASH & REAM F/3290' T/3497' Rot. Hrs: 62

0:30 2:00 1:30 DRLG. F/3497' T/3520'

2:00 3:30 1:30 CIRC. &PUMP SWEEPS

3:00 6:00 3:00 TRIP OUT TO RUN 8 5/8" CSG.

P/U LITH: TRIP GAS

S/O CONN

ROT. BKG GAS

S.L.SEELY PEAK



†'3- W-~sÿÿÿ GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: PRESSURE TEST BOPs Date: 5/20/2004 Days: 7

Depth: 3520' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0 |Formation:

DMC: $277 TMC: $6,294 TDC: $43,954 CWC: $374,632

Contractor: Nat ors #924 Mud Co: M-! TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Water Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: KA 4512 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: SPM: 200 Size: 12 1/2 int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: 2100 MFG: REED Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 860 Type: HP 53 A Float Equp: $ 2,235 Cement: $ 16,343

WL: NV: 300 Jets: 3 X 24 Well Head: $ 4,064 Casing Crew: $ 6,490

Cake: AV: 146/163 In: 3497 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 325

Sand: Dev: Out: 3520 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: FTG: 23 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chls: Hrs: 1 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: 15.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: 0/E/0 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 277

Ca: WOB: 40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,310

Timt Break Doven: RPM: 65 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $6,299 Daily Total: $37,655
6:00 7:30 1:30 POOH & LAY DOWN 8" DCs cum.wtr: $ 3,552

7:30 8:30 1:00 RIG UP T&MCASERS & HELD SAFETY MEETING Cum. Fuel $ 11,248

8:30 13:30 5:00 RAN 87Jts. 8 5/8" 28# M-50 WITH DILFLOAT SHOE &COLLAR cum.Bits: $ 8,000

TOTAL 3516.52' - SHOE @ 3514' Rot. Hrs: 62

13:30 15:30 2:00 RIG UP CMT. HEAD & CIRC. WELL FOR CMT.

15:30 18:00 2:30 CMT. WITH SCHLUMBERGER PUMPED 20 bbl WATER AHEAD OF LEAD: 540 Sk Hi-Lift WT.

11 ppgYlELD 3.91 376 bbl - TAIL: 230 Sk "G"WT. 14.2 ppg YIELD 1.63 67 bbl - DROP PLUG &

DISP. WITH 217 bbl WATER - PLUG BUMPED FLOATS HELD - 80 bbl CMT TO SURF. - CMT.

FELL - TOPOUT WITH 90 Sk "G"WT. 15 PPg 18 bbl - HOLE STAYED FULL

18:00 19:00 1:00 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER & BACK OUT LANDINGJT.

19:00 4:00 9:00 NIPPLE UP BOPs &CHOKE

4:00 5:00 1:00 FUCTION TEST BOPs

5:00 6:00 1:00 TEST BOPs TO 5000 psi

P/U LITH: TRIP GAS

S/O CONN

ROT. BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK

†'3- W-~sÿÿÿ GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: PRESSURE TEST BOPs Date: 5/20/2004 Days: 7

Depth: 3520' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0 |Formation:

DMC: $277 TMC: $6,294 TDC: $43,954 CWC: $374,632

Contractor: Nat ors #924 Mud Co: M-! TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Water Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 2 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: KA 4512 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: SPM: 200 Size: 12 1/2 int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: 2100 MFG: REED Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 860 Type: HP 53 A Float Equp: $ 2,235 Cement: $ 16,343

WL: NV: 300 Jets: 3 X 24 Well Head: $ 4,064 Casing Crew: $ 6,490

Cake: AV: 146/163 In: 3497 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 325

Sand: Dev: Out: 3520 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: FTG: 23 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chls: Hrs: 1 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: 15.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: 0/E/0 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 277

Ca: WOB: 40 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,310

Timt Break Doven: RPM: 65 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $6,299 Daily Total: $37,655
6:00 7:30 1:30 POOH & LAY DOWN 8" DCs cum.wtr: $ 3,552

7:30 8:30 1:00 RIG UP T&MCASERS & HELD SAFETY MEETING Cum. Fuel $ 11,248

8:30 13:30 5:00 RAN 87Jts. 8 5/8" 28# M-50 WITH DILFLOAT SHOE &COLLAR cum.Bits: $ 8,000

TOTAL 3516.52' - SHOE @ 3514' Rot. Hrs: 62

13:30 15:30 2:00 RIG UP CMT. HEAD & CIRC. WELL FOR CMT.

15:30 18:00 2:30 CMT. WITH SCHLUMBERGER PUMPED 20 bbl WATER AHEAD OF LEAD: 540 Sk Hi-Lift WT.

11 ppgYlELD 3.91 376 bbl - TAIL: 230 Sk "G"WT. 14.2 ppg YIELD 1.63 67 bbl - DROP PLUG &

DISP. WITH 217 bbl WATER - PLUG BUMPED FLOATS HELD - 80 bbl CMT TO SURF. - CMT.

FELL - TOPOUT WITH 90 Sk "G"WT. 15 PPg 18 bbl - HOLE STAYED FULL

18:00 19:00 1:00 RIG DOWN SCHLUMBERGER & BACK OUT LANDINGJT.

19:00 4:00 9:00 NIPPLE UP BOPs &CHOKE

4:00 5:00 1:00 FUCTION TEST BOPs

5:00 6:00 1:00 TEST BOPs TO 5000 psi

P/U LITH: TRIP GAS

S/O CONN

ROT. BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK



nis R/m s O GASCO ENERGY
Ø¶ý- 3 ÁN DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: CHANGE LOWER KELLY VALAE Date: 5/21/2004 Days: 8

Depth: Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation:

DMC: $1,084 TMC: $7,378 TDC: $21,706 CWC: $396,338

Contractor: WaterNators # 924

6 1/2 it

#dCo: M-I TANGIBLE \WFANGleE3LE

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: 200 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: 2100 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 860 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 300 Jets: 15-Jun Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 146/163 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,084

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 4,637

Time Break Dos n: RPM: Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $21,706

6:00 21:30 15:30 PRESSURE TEST BOP, KELLY,CHOKE & LINES TO 5000 psi cum.wtr: $ 3,552

HYDRIL TO 2500 psi Cum. Fuel $ 11,248

21:30 22:00 0:30 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING cum.sits: $ 8,000

22:00 5:00 7:00 PICK UP BHA &TRIP IN HOLE TO 3300' Rot. Hrs: 62

5:00 6:00 1:00 CHANGE LOWER KELLYVALVE BHA OD LENGTH

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U LITH: TRIP GAS

S/O CONN

ROT. BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK

nis R/m s O GASCO ENERGY
Ø¶ý- 3 ÁN DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: CHANGE LOWER KELLY VALAE Date: 5/21/2004 Days: 8

Depth: Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation:

DMC: $1,084 TMC: $7,378 TDC: $21,706 CWC: $396,338

Contractor: WaterNators # 924

6 1/2 it

#dCo: M-I TANGIBLE \WFANGleE3LE

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: SPM: 200 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: 2100 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 860 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 300 Jets: 15-Jun Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 146/163 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,084

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 4,637

Time Break Dos n: RPM: Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $21,706

6:00 21:30 15:30 PRESSURE TEST BOP, KELLY,CHOKE & LINES TO 5000 psi cum.wtr: $ 3,552

HYDRIL TO 2500 psi Cum. Fuel $ 11,248

21:30 22:00 0:30 INSTALL WEAR BUSHING cum.sits: $ 8,000

22:00 5:00 7:00 PICK UP BHA &TRIP IN HOLE TO 3300' Rot. Hrs: 62

5:00 6:00 1:00 CHANGE LOWER KELLYVALVE BHA OD LENGTH

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U LITH: TRIP GAS

S/O CONN

ROT. BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK



ois R/'7E & al GASCO ENERGY
3-06- Sf Šd DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/22/2004 Days: 9

Depth: 4273' Prog: 753 D Hrs: 17 1/2 AV ROP: 43 Formation: Green River

DMC: $4,162 TMC: $11,540 TDC: $28,184 CWC: $424,522

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 s/N: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1 / 1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1 / 1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8.5 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 15-Jun Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 3/4 3634 Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 7,000

Solids: 2 Dev: 1 1/2 4137 FTG: 753 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chls: 4000 Hrs: 17 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .7 / 4.2 FPH: 43 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 2.6 T/BIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,162

Ca: 120 WOB: 15-Oct Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,037

Time Break Dosyn: RPM: 60 l90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $28,184

6:00 7:00 1:00 CHANGE LOWER KELLYVALVE & INSTALLCORR. RING cum.wtr: $ 3,552

7:00 11:00 4:00 DRILLFLOAT Eq. &CMT. Cum. Fuel $ 11,248

11:00 15:00 4:00 DRLG. Fl3520' T/3676' 156' 39 fph cum.Bits: $ 8,000

15:00 15:30 0:30 SURVEY @ 3634' 1 3/4 Deg. Rot. Hrs: ¯/9 1/2

15:30 16:30 1:00 DRLG. F/3676' T/3708' 32' 32 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

16:30 17:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

17:00 3:30 10:30 DRLG F/3708' T/4179' 471' 44.9 fph SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

3:30 4:00 0:30 SURVEY @4137' 1 1/2 Deg. 24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

4:00 6:00 2:00 DRLG. Fl4179' T/4273' 94' 47 fph

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 135 LITH: SH / SS TRIP GAS

S/O 135 CONN

ROT. 135 BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK

ois R/'7E & al GASCO ENERGY
3-06- Sf Šd DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/22/2004 Days: 9

Depth: 4273' Prog: 753 D Hrs: 17 1/2 AV ROP: 43 Formation: Green River

DMC: $4,162 TMC: $11,540 TDC: $28,184 CWC: $424,522

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 s/N: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1 / 1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1 / 1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8.5 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 15-Jun Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 3/4 3634 Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 7,000

Solids: 2 Dev: 1 1/2 4137 FTG: 753 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chls: 4000 Hrs: 17 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .7 / 4.2 FPH: 43 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 2.6 T/BIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,162

Ca: 120 WOB: 15-Oct Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,037

Time Break Dosyn: RPM: 60 l90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $28,184

6:00 7:00 1:00 CHANGE LOWER KELLYVALVE & INSTALLCORR. RING cum.wtr: $ 3,552

7:00 11:00 4:00 DRILLFLOAT Eq. &CMT. Cum. Fuel $ 11,248

11:00 15:00 4:00 DRLG. Fl3520' T/3676' 156' 39 fph cum.Bits: $ 8,000

15:00 15:30 0:30 SURVEY @ 3634' 1 3/4 Deg. Rot. Hrs: ¯/9 1/2

15:30 16:30 1:00 DRLG. F/3676' T/3708' 32' 32 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

16:30 17:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

17:00 3:30 10:30 DRLG F/3708' T/4179' 471' 44.9 fph SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

3:30 4:00 0:30 SURVEY @4137' 1 1/2 Deg. 24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

4:00 6:00 2:00 DRLG. Fl4179' T/4273' 94' 47 fph

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 135 LITH: SH / SS TRIP GAS

S/O 135 CONN

ROT. 135 BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK



GASCO ENERGY
Y DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/24/2004 Days: 11

Depth: 5575' Prog: 453 D Hrs: 21 AV ROP: 21.6 Formation: Wasatch @5470'

DMC: $894 TMC: $16,158 TDC: $16,879 CWC: $441,401

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 27 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 7.5 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 1/2 5102 Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2 Dev: FTG: 2055 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chls: 4100 Hrs: 61 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/5.6 FPH: 33.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.8 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 894

Ca: 120 wos: 15-Oct Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dos n: RPM: 60 /90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $16,879

6:00 6:30 0:30 DRLG. Fl5122' T/5149' 27' 54 fph cum.Wtr: $ 18,827

6:30 7:30 1:00 SURVEY @ 5102' 1 1/2 Deg. Cum. Fuel $ 11,248

7:30 13:30 6:00 DRLG. F/5149' T/5337' 188' 31.3 fph Cum. Bits: $ 23,000

13:30 14:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE Rot. Hrs:

14:00 16:30 2:30 DRLG. Fl5337' Tl5400' 63' 25.2 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

16:30 18:00 1:30 LINE UP KELLYDRIVE FOR ROT. HEAD M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

18:00 6:00 12:00 DRLG. F/5400' T/5575' 175' 14.6 fph SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 165 LITH: SILTYSHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 155 CONN 90

ROT. 160 BKG GAS 50

S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS

GASCO ENERGY
Y DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/24/2004 Days: 11

Depth: 5575' Prog: 453 D Hrs: 21 AV ROP: 21.6 Formation: Wasatch @5470'

DMC: $894 TMC: $16,158 TDC: $16,879 CWC: $441,401

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 27 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 7.5 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 1/2 5102 Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2 Dev: FTG: 2055 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,000

Chls: 4100 Hrs: 61 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/5.6 FPH: 33.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.8 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 894

Ca: 120 wos: 15-Oct Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dos n: RPM: 60 /90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $16,879

6:00 6:30 0:30 DRLG. Fl5122' T/5149' 27' 54 fph cum.Wtr: $ 18,827

6:30 7:30 1:00 SURVEY @ 5102' 1 1/2 Deg. Cum. Fuel $ 11,248

7:30 13:30 6:00 DRLG. F/5149' T/5337' 188' 31.3 fph Cum. Bits: $ 23,000

13:30 14:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE Rot. Hrs:

14:00 16:30 2:30 DRLG. Fl5337' Tl5400' 63' 25.2 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

16:30 18:00 1:30 LINE UP KELLYDRIVE FOR ROT. HEAD M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

18:00 6:00 12:00 DRLG. F/5400' T/5575' 175' 14.6 fph SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 165 LITH: SILTYSHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 155 CONN 90

ROT. 160 BKG GAS 50

S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS



Tais 2/7f Em A GASCO ENERGY
L/3-dt/ý- SI-/$OS DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/25/2004 Days: 12

Depth: 6058' Prog: 483 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 21 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $1,522 TMC: $17,680 TDC: $33,929 CWC: $475,330

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

Vis: 25 Stroke: 10 s/N: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 13,112

ph: 7.5 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 1/2 5578 Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

I Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 2538 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 4000 Hrs: 84 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/4.9 FPH: 30 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.6 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,522

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,400

Time Break Down: RPM: 60 / 90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $33,929

6:00 8:00 2:00 DRLG. F/5575' T/5620' 45' 22.5 fph cum.wtr: $ 18,827

8:00 8:30 0:30 SURVEY @5578' 1 1/2 Deg. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

8:30 9:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Bits: $ 23,000

9:00 6:00 21:00 DRLG. F/5620' T/6058' 438' 20.9 fph Rot. Hrs: 46 1/2

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 170 LITH: SILTY SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 160 CONN 90

ROT. 168 BKG GAS 50

S.L.SEELY PEAK

Tais 2/7f Em A GASCO ENERGY
L/3-dt/ý- SI-/$OS DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/25/2004 Days: 12

Depth: 6058' Prog: 483 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 21 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $1,522 TMC: $17,680 TDC: $33,929 CWC: $475,330

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

Vis: 25 Stroke: 10 s/N: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 13,112

ph: 7.5 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1 1/2 5578 Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

I Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 2538 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 4000 Hrs: 84 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/4.9 FPH: 30 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.6 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,522

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,400

Time Break Down: RPM: 60 / 90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $33,929

6:00 8:00 2:00 DRLG. F/5575' T/5620' 45' 22.5 fph cum.wtr: $ 18,827

8:00 8:30 0:30 SURVEY @5578' 1 1/2 Deg. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

8:30 9:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Bits: $ 23,000

9:00 6:00 21:00 DRLG. F/5620' T/6058' 438' 20.9 fph Rot. Hrs: 46 1/2

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 170 LITH: SILTY SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 160 CONN 90

ROT. 168 BKG GAS 50

S.L.SEELY PEAK



o¶S /f /fE S / Û GASCO ENERGY $
3-g ý't- St/b CSS DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED, 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/26/2004 Days: 13

Depth: 6554' Prog: 496 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 21.6 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $1,518 TMC: $19,198 TDC: $22,615 $497,945

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGlBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 3,245

Sand: Dev: 2 6079 Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 3034 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 6100 Hrs: 107 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/5.3
FPH: 28.2 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.8 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,518

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 957

Time Break Don'n: RPM: 60 / 90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $22,615

6:00 8:30 2:30 DRLG. F/6058' T/6121' 63' 25.2 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

8:30 9:00 0:30 SURVEY @6079' 2 Deg. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

9:00 17:30 8:30 DRLG. Fl6121' Tl6278' 157' 18.5 fph cum.Bits: $ 23,000

17:30 18:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE Rot. Hrs:

18:00 6:00 12:00 DRLG. Fl6278' T/6554' 266' 22.2 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 178 LITH: SAND - SILT - SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 170 CONN 60

ROT. 175 BKG GAS 120

S.L.SEELY PEAK

o¶S /f /fE S / Û GASCO ENERGY $
3-g ý't- St/b CSS DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED, 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/26/2004 Days: 13

Depth: 6554' Prog: 496 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 21.6 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $1,518 TMC: $19,198 TDC: $22,615 $497,945

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGlBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 3,245

Sand: Dev: 2 6079 Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 3034 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 6100 Hrs: 107 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/5.3
FPH: 28.2 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.8 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,518

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 957

Time Break Don'n: RPM: 60 / 90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $22,615

6:00 8:30 2:30 DRLG. F/6058' T/6121' 63' 25.2 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

8:30 9:00 0:30 SURVEY @6079' 2 Deg. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

9:00 17:30 8:30 DRLG. Fl6121' Tl6278' 157' 18.5 fph cum.Bits: $ 23,000

17:30 18:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE Rot. Hrs:

18:00 6:00 12:00 DRLG. Fl6278' T/6554' 266' 22.2 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 178 LITH: SAND - SILT - SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 170 CONN 60

ROT. 175 BKG GAS 120

S.L.SEELY PEAK



avs gifE A GASCO ENERGY
-A 'ZAN DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

0 23
Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/27/2004 Days: 14

Depth: 7100' Prog: 546 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 23.7 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $265 TMC: $19,463 TDC: $18,599 CWC: $516,544

Contractor: Nal ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 450

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 2 6582' Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 3580 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 6100 Hrs: 130 1/2 Separator: $ - corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/5.3 FPH: 27.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.8 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 265

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 989

Time Break Down: RPM: 60 / 90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $18,599

6:00 8:30 2:30 DRLG. F/6554' T/6624' 70' 28 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

8:30 9:00 0:30 SURVEY @6582' 2 Deg. cum.Fuel $ 24,360

9:00 16:30 7:30 DRLG. Fl6624' Tl6812' 188' 25.1 fph cum.Bits: $ 23,000

16:30 17:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE Rot. Hrs:

17:00 6:00 13:00 DRLG. F/6824' T/7100' 276' 21.2 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 190 LITH: SHALE - SILT - SAND TRIP GAS

S/O 175 CONN 120

ROT. 185 BKG GAS 60
S.L.SEELY PEAK

avs gifE A GASCO ENERGY
-A 'ZAN DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

0 23
Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/27/2004 Days: 14

Depth: 7100' Prog: 546 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 23.7 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $265 TMC: $19,463 TDC: $18,599 CWC: $516,544

Contractor: Nal ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 450

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 2 6582' Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 3580 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 6100 Hrs: 130 1/2 Separator: $ - corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/5.3 FPH: 27.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.8 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 265

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 989

Time Break Down: RPM: 60 / 90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $18,599

6:00 8:30 2:30 DRLG. F/6554' T/6624' 70' 28 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

8:30 9:00 0:30 SURVEY @6582' 2 Deg. cum.Fuel $ 24,360

9:00 16:30 7:30 DRLG. Fl6624' Tl6812' 188' 25.1 fph cum.Bits: $ 23,000

16:30 17:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE Rot. Hrs:

17:00 6:00 13:00 DRLG. F/6824' T/7100' 276' 21.2 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 190 LITH: SHALE - SILT - SAND TRIP GAS

S/O 175 CONN 120

ROT. 185 BKG GAS 60
S.L.SEELY PEAK



oss a jfE sai GASCO ENERGY $
L(3-d¶ÿ-2Ÿ$6 DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/28/2004 Days: 15

Depth: 7488' Prog: 388 D Hrs: 21.5 AV ROP: 18.1 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $938 TMC: $20,401 TDC: $18,208 CWC: $534,752

Contractor: Nai ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 in: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 3968 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 7500 Hrs: 152 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

Pf/Mf: .5/4.9 FPH: 26.1 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.4 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 938

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 375

Time Break Down: RPM: 60 / 90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $18,208

6:00 15:00 9:00 DRLG. F/7100' T/7252' 152' 16.9 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

15:00 15:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 24,360

15:30 21:00 5:30 DRLG. F/7252' T/7350' 98' 17.8 fph cum.Bits: $ 23,000

21:00 23:00 2:00 PULLED 5 STDS. &CHANGED SWIVEL PACKING Rot. Hrs: 214

23:00 6:00 7:00 DRLG. F/7350' T/7488' 138' 19.7 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 194 LITH: SHALE - SILT - SANDSTONE TRIP GAS 1200

S/O 186 CONN 70

ROT. 190 BKG GAS 120
S.L.SEELY PEAK

oss a jfE sai GASCO ENERGY $
L(3-d¶ÿ-2Ÿ$6 DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/28/2004 Days: 15

Depth: 7488' Prog: 388 D Hrs: 21.5 AV ROP: 18.1 Formation: WASATCH

DMC: $938 TMC: $20,401 TDC: $18,208 CWC: $534,752

Contractor: Nai ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 in: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 3968 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 7500 Hrs: 152 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

Pf/Mf: .5/4.9 FPH: 26.1 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.4 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 938

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 375

Time Break Down: RPM: 60 / 90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $18,208

6:00 15:00 9:00 DRLG. F/7100' T/7252' 152' 16.9 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

15:00 15:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 24,360

15:30 21:00 5:30 DRLG. F/7252' T/7350' 98' 17.8 fph cum.Bits: $ 23,000

21:00 23:00 2:00 PULLED 5 STDS. &CHANGED SWIVEL PACKING Rot. Hrs: 214

23:00 6:00 7:00 DRLG. F/7350' T/7488' 138' 19.7 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 194 LITH: SHALE - SILT - SANDSTONE TRIP GAS 1200

S/O 186 CONN 70

ROT. 190 BKG GAS 120
S.L.SEELY PEAK



Tass sat * GASCO ENERGY
'3 DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/29/2004 Days: 16

Depth: 7924' Prog: 436 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 18.5 Formation: North Horn

DMC: $3,070 TMC: $23,471 TDC: $20,575 CWC: $555,327

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 7.5 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weli Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 in: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 4404 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 7500 Hrs: 175 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/5.0 FPH: 25.1 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.6 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,070

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 610

Time Break Dovn: RPM: 60 / 90 Mise: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $20,575

6:00 8:30 2:30 DRLG. F/7488' T/7525' 37' 14.8 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

8:30 9:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 24,360

9:00 6:00 21:00 DRLG. Fl7525' Tl7924' 399' 19 fph cum.Bits: $ 23,000

Rot. Hrs: 237.5

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 208 LITH: SAND &SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 195 CONN 400

ROT. 200 BKG GAS 150

S.L.SEELY PEAK

Tass sat * GASCO ENERGY
'3 DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/29/2004 Days: 16

Depth: 7924' Prog: 436 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 18.5 Formation: North Horn

DMC: $3,070 TMC: $23,471 TDC: $20,575 CWC: $555,327

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 7.5 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weli Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 in: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 4404 Tanks: $ - Rentai Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 7500 Hrs: 175 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/5.0 FPH: 25.1 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.6 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,070

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 610

Time Break Dovn: RPM: 60 / 90 Mise: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $20,575

6:00 8:30 2:30 DRLG. F/7488' T/7525' 37' 14.8 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

8:30 9:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 24,360

9:00 6:00 21:00 DRLG. Fl7525' Tl7924' 399' 19 fph cum.Bits: $ 23,000

Rot. Hrs: 237.5

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 208 LITH: SAND &SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 195 CONN 400

ROT. 200 BKG GAS 150

S.L.SEELY PEAK



GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP OUT FOR BIT Date: 5/30/2004 Days: 17

Depth: 8197' Prog: 273 D Hrs: 18 AV ROP: 15.2 Formation: North Horn

DMC: $0 TMC: $23,471 TDC: $16,895 CWC: $572,222
Contractor: Nat ors #924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: 8197 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 4677 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 7600 Hrs: 193 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/4.8 FPH: 24.2 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.6 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dos n: RPM: 60 / 90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $16,895

6:00 13:00 7:00 DRLG. F/7924' T/8008' 84' 12 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

13:00 13:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 24,360

13:30 0:30 11:00 DRLG. F/8008' Tl8197' 189' 17.2 fph (mud motor pressuredup) cum.Bits: $ 23,000

0:30 1:00 0:30 CIRC. DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL Rot. Hrs:

1:00 6:00 5:00 TRIP OUT FOR BIT BIT 77/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 212 LITH: SAND &SHALE TRIP GAS

SIO 194 CONN 200

ROT. 202 BKG GAS 100
S.L.SEELY PEAK

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLING AND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP OUT FOR BIT Date: 5/30/2004 Days: 17

Depth: 8197' Prog: 273 D Hrs: 18 AV ROP: 15.2 Formation: North Horn

DMC: $0 TMC: $23,471 TDC: $16,895 CWC: $572,222
Contractor: Nat ors #924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC Prod csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: 8197 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 4677 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 7600 Hrs: 193 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/4.8 FPH: 24.2 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.6 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dos n: RPM: 60 / 90 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $16,895

6:00 13:00 7:00 DRLG. F/7924' T/8008' 84' 12 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

13:00 13:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 24,360

13:30 0:30 11:00 DRLG. F/8008' Tl8197' 189' 17.2 fph (mud motor pressuredup) cum.Bits: $ 23,000

0:30 1:00 0:30 CIRC. DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL Rot. Hrs:

1:00 6:00 5:00 TRIP OUT FOR BIT BIT 77/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 212 LITH: SAND &SHALE TRIP GAS

SIO 194 CONN 200

ROT. 202 BKG GAS 100
S.L.SEELY PEAK



GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/31/2004 Days: 18

Depth: 8526' Prog: 329 D Hrs: 12 AV ROP: 27.4 Formation: North Horn

DMC: $398 TMC: $23,869 TDC: $24,293 CWC: $596,515
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 8197 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1.5 8160' Out: 8197 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 7,000

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 4677 329 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 7500 Hrs: 193 1/2 12 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/5.0 FPH: 24.2 27.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.7 TIBIG: 5 / na / \ Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 398

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dovn: RPM: 60 / 90 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $24,293

6:00 7:00 1:00 TRIP OUT FOR BIT cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

7:00 9:00 2:00 CHANGE MUD MOTOR &BIT - (SURVEY @8160' 1 1/2 Deg.) Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

9:00 10:30 1:30 TRIP INWITH BHA cum.Bits: $ 30,000

10:30 13:30 3:00 SLIP &CUT DRILLINGLINE Rot. Hrs: 267.5

13:30 15:30 2:00 TRIP INTO 8100' ( NO TIGHT HOLE) BIT 77/8 1.10

15:30 16:00 0:30 ISTALL ROT. HEAD M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

16:00 18:00 2:00 BREAK CIRC. & WASH TO BTM.@8197' SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

18:00 6:00 12:00 DRLG. F/8197' T/8526' 329' 27.4 fph 24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 214 LITH: SAND &SHALE TRIP GAS 2300

S/O 195 CONN 600

ROT. 204 BKG GAS 400
S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 5/31/2004 Days: 18

Depth: 8526' Prog: 329 D Hrs: 12 AV ROP: 27.4 Formation: North Horn

DMC: $398 TMC: $23,869 TDC: $24,293 CWC: $596,515
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 3 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 25 Stroke: 10 SIN: 7104379 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 1/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HTC HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: HC 506 DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: 6 / 15 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: 215 / 320 In: 3520 8197 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: 1.5 8160' Out: 8197 Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ 7,000

Solids: 1 Dev: FTG: 4677 329 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 7500 Hrs: 193 1/2 12 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/5.0 FPH: 24.2 27.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.7 TIBIG: 5 / na / \ Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 398

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dovn: RPM: 60 / 90 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $24,293

6:00 7:00 1:00 TRIP OUT FOR BIT cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

7:00 9:00 2:00 CHANGE MUD MOTOR &BIT - (SURVEY @8160' 1 1/2 Deg.) Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

9:00 10:30 1:30 TRIP INWITH BHA cum.Bits: $ 30,000

10:30 13:30 3:00 SLIP &CUT DRILLINGLINE Rot. Hrs: 267.5

13:30 15:30 2:00 TRIP INTO 8100' ( NO TIGHT HOLE) BIT 77/8 1.10

15:30 16:00 0:30 ISTALL ROT. HEAD M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

16:00 18:00 2:00 BREAK CIRC. & WASH TO BTM.@8197' SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

18:00 6:00 12:00 DRLG. F/8197' T/8526' 329' 27.4 fph 24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 214 LITH: SAND &SHALE TRIP GAS 2300

S/O 195 CONN 600

ROT. 204 BKG GAS 400
S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS



GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/1/2004 Days: 19

Depth: 9054' Prog: 528 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 22.9 Formation: North Horn

DMC: $4,127 TMC: $27,996 TDC: $31,769 CWC: $628,284
Contractor: Nat ors #924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.7 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

Vis: 32 Stroke: 10 SIN: 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 2/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 10,427

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: DSX 199 Fioat Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 28 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 2 AV: 215 / 320 In: 8197 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 320

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2 Dev: FTG: 857 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

chis: 7500 Hrs: 35 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/5.0 FPH: 24.5 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.5 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,127

Ca: 120 wos: 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timi Break Dos «n: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $31,769

6:00 6:30 0:30 DRLG. F/8526' T/8574' 48' 96 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,392

6:30 7:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 34,787

7:00 6:00 23:00 DRLG. Fl8574' T/9054' 480' 20.9 fph cum.Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 222 LITH: SAND &SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 207 CONN 1200

ROT. 213 BKG GAS 1200
S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/1/2004 Days: 19

Depth: 9054' Prog: 528 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 22.9 Formation: North Horn

DMC: $4,127 TMC: $27,996 TDC: $31,769 CWC: $628,284
Contractor: Nat ors #924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.7 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

Vis: 32 Stroke: 10 SIN: 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 2/1 SPM: 104 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1300 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 10,427

ph: 8 GPM: 422 Type: DSX 199 Fioat Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 28 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 2 AV: 215 / 320 In: 8197 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 320

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2 Dev: FTG: 857 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

chis: 7500 Hrs: 35 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/5.0 FPH: 24.5 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.5 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,127

Ca: 120 wos: 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timi Break Dos «n: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $31,769

6:00 6:30 0:30 DRLG. F/8526' T/8574' 48' 96 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,392

6:30 7:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 34,787

7:00 6:00 23:00 DRLG. Fl8574' T/9054' 480' 20.9 fph cum.Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 222 LITH: SAND &SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 207 CONN 1200

ROT. 213 BKG GAS 1200
S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS



e « s O GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/2/2004 Days: 20

Depth: 9442' Prog: 388 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 16.5 |Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $4,277 TMC: $32,273 TDC: $34,772 CWC: $663,056
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.8 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 32 Stroke: 10 SIN: 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 2/3 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 13,090

ph: 8.5 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12.6 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 2 AV: 223 / 333 in: 8197 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2.75 Dev: FTG: 1245 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 8200 Hrs: 59 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/4.8 FPH: 21.1 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.3 TIB/G: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,277

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 510

Time Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $34,772

6:00 13:00 7:00 DRLG. F/9054' T/9201' 147' 21 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

13:00 13:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 37,450

13:30 6:00 16:30 DRLG. F/9201' T/9442' 241' 14.6 fph cum.Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs: 314.5

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 224 LITH: 60% SANDSTONE - 40% SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 210 CONN 500

ROT. 214 BKG GAS 500

S.L.SEELY PEAK

e « s O GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/2/2004 Days: 20

Depth: 9442' Prog: 388 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 16.5 |Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $4,277 TMC: $32,273 TDC: $34,772 CWC: $663,056
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 8.8 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 32 Stroke: 10 SIN: 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 2/3 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 1/1 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 13,090

ph: 8.5 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12.6 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 2 AV: 223 / 333 in: 8197 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 2.75 Dev: FTG: 1245 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 8200 Hrs: 59 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/4.8 FPH: 21.1 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.3 TIB/G: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,277

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 510

Time Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $34,772

6:00 13:00 7:00 DRLG. F/9054' T/9201' 147' 21 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

13:00 13:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 37,450

13:30 6:00 16:30 DRLG. F/9201' T/9442' 241' 14.6 fph cum.Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs: 314.5

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 224 LITH: 60% SANDSTONE - 40% SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 210 CONN 500

ROT. 214 BKG GAS 500

S.L.SEELY PEAK



jf /ff S al GASCO ENERGY
dyp /br y DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/3/2004 Days: 21

Depth: 9859' Prog: 417' D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 17.7 |Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $3,196 TMC: $35,469 TDC: $24,034 CWC: $687,090
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.0 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 34 Stroke: 10 SIN: 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 3/4 SPM: 107 size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 2/2 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12.4 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 2 AV: 223 / 333 In: 8197 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 1,800

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 5 Dev: FTG: 1662 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 9000 Hrs: 82 1/2 separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

Pf/Mf: .3/4.5 FPH: 20.1 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,196

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,143

Time Break Dovn: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $24,034

6:00 12:00 6:00 DRLG. F/9442' T/9577' 135' 22.5 fph cum.Wtr: $ 23,872

12:00 12:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

12:30 6:00 17:30 DRLG. F/9577' T/9859' 282' 16.1 fph Cum. Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs: 338

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 240 LITH: 80% Sandstone - 20% Shale TRIP GAS

S/O 219 FLARE: 5 - 7 ft. CONN 1000

ROT. 225 BKG GAS 1000
S.L.SEELY PEAK

jf /ff S al GASCO ENERGY
dyp /br y DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/3/2004 Days: 21

Depth: 9859' Prog: 417' D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 17.7 |Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $3,196 TMC: $35,469 TDC: $24,034 CWC: $687,090
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.0 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 34 Stroke: 10 SIN: 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 3/4 SPM: 107 size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 2/2 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12.4 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 2 AV: 223 / 333 In: 8197 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 1,800

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 5 Dev: FTG: 1662 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 9000 Hrs: 82 1/2 separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

Pf/Mf: .3/4.5 FPH: 20.1 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,196

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 2,143

Time Break Dovn: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $24,034

6:00 12:00 6:00 DRLG. F/9442' T/9577' 135' 22.5 fph cum.Wtr: $ 23,872

12:00 12:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

12:30 6:00 17:30 DRLG. F/9577' T/9859' 282' 16.1 fph Cum. Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs: 338

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 240 LITH: 80% Sandstone - 20% Shale TRIP GAS

S/O 219 FLARE: 5 - 7 ft. CONN 1000

ROT. 225 BKG GAS 1000
S.L.SEELY PEAK



O GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG Date: 6/4/2004 Days: 22

Depth: 10176' Prog: 317 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 13.5 Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $3,702 TMC: $39,171 TDC: $21,245 CWC: $708,335
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.1 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 34 Stroke: 10 SIN: 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 648

PVIYP: 3/4 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 2/5 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 20 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 2 AV: 223 / 333 in: 8197 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 5.75 Dev: FTG: 1979 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 9000 Hrs: 106 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .2/4.5 FPH: 18.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,702

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dovn: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $21,245

6:00 9:00 3:00 DRLG. F/9859' T/9922' 63' 21 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

9:00 9:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

9:30 6:00 20:30 DRLG. F/9922' Tl10176' 254' 12.4 fph Cum. Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs: 361.5

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 246 LITH: 80% SANDSTONE - 20%SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 225 FLARE: 2' - 5' CONN 2600

ROT. 232 BKG GAS 2600

S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS

O GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG Date: 6/4/2004 Days: 22

Depth: 10176' Prog: 317 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 13.5 Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $3,702 TMC: $39,171 TDC: $21,245 CWC: $708,335
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.1 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 4 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 34 Stroke: 10 SIN: 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 648

PVIYP: 3/4 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 2/5 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 20 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 2 AV: 223 / 333 in: 8197 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 5.75 Dev: FTG: 1979 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 9000 Hrs: 106 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .2/4.5 FPH: 18.7 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 4.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,702

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Dovn: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $21,245

6:00 9:00 3:00 DRLG. F/9859' T/9922' 63' 21 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

9:00 9:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

9:30 6:00 20:30 DRLG. F/9922' Tl10176' 254' 12.4 fph Cum. Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs: 361.5

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 246 LITH: 80% SANDSTONE - 20%SHALE TRIP GAS

S/O 225 FLARE: 2' - 5' CONN 2600

ROT. 232 BKG GAS 2600

S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS



TS R/yg s y GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/5/2004 Days: 23

Depth: 10270' Prog: 94 D Hrs: 9.5 AV ROP: 9.9 Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $3,996 TMC: $43,167 TDC: $21,972 CWC: $730,307
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.4 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 33 Stroke: 10 SIN: 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 5/5 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 4/5 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18.6 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 8197 10249 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: 10249 Packers: $ - Bits I corehead: $ -

Solids: 6.4 Dev: FTG: 2052 21 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

chis: 6500 Hrs: 114 1.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.2 FPH: 18 14 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.4 TIBIG: 6 / NAI l Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,996

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,081

Time Break Donn: RPM: 55 / 56 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $21,972

6:00 8:00 2:00 DRLG. F/10176' T/10202' 26' 13 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

8:00 8:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

8:30 14:30 6:00 DRLG. F/10202' T/10249' 47' 7.8 fph cum.Bits: $ 30,000

14:30 15:00 0:30 DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL FOR BITTRIP Rot. Hrs:

15:00 20:30 5:30 TRIP OUT FOR BIT (NO TIGHT HOLE) BIT 77/8 1.10

20:30 22:30 2:00 CHANGE BIT & MUDMOTOR M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

22:30 4:00 5:30 TRIP INWITH BIT# 5 SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

4:00 4:30 0:30 BREAKCIRC.& WASH 60' TO BTM. (NO FILL) 24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

4:30 6:00 1:30 DRLG F/10249' T/10270' 21' 14 fph

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 248 LITH: 80% Sandstone - 20% Shale TRIP GAS 3600

S/O 228 FLARE: CONN 2600

ROT. 234 BKGGAS 2600

S.L.SEELY PEAK

TS R/yg s y GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/5/2004 Days: 23

Depth: 10270' Prog: 94 D Hrs: 9.5 AV ROP: 9.9 Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $3,996 TMC: $43,167 TDC: $21,972 CWC: $730,307
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.4 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 4 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 33 Stroke: 10 SIN: 100344 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 5/5 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 4/5 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18.6 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 8197 10249 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: 10249 Packers: $ - Bits I corehead: $ -

Solids: 6.4 Dev: FTG: 2052 21 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

chis: 6500 Hrs: 114 1.5 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.2 FPH: 18 14 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.4 TIBIG: 6 / NAI l Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,996

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,081

Time Break Donn: RPM: 55 / 56 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $21,972

6:00 8:00 2:00 DRLG. F/10176' T/10202' 26' 13 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

8:00 8:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

8:30 14:30 6:00 DRLG. F/10202' T/10249' 47' 7.8 fph cum.Bits: $ 30,000

14:30 15:00 0:30 DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL FOR BITTRIP Rot. Hrs:

15:00 20:30 5:30 TRIP OUT FOR BIT (NO TIGHT HOLE) BIT 77/8 1.10

20:30 22:30 2:00 CHANGE BIT & MUDMOTOR M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

22:30 4:00 5:30 TRIP INWITH BIT# 5 SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

4:00 4:30 0:30 BREAKCIRC.& WASH 60' TO BTM. (NO FILL) 24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

4:30 6:00 1:30 DRLG F/10249' T/10270' 21' 14 fph

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 248 LITH: 80% Sandstone - 20% Shale TRIP GAS 3600

S/O 228 FLARE: CONN 2600

ROT. 234 BKGGAS 2600

S.L.SEELY PEAK



3 X/îß GASCO ENERGY
L 1 f-) O DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/6/2004 Days: 24

Depth: 10605' Prog: 335 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 14.6 Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $2,309 TMC: $45,476 TDC: $20,292 CWC: $750,599
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 35 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 5/6 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 6/7 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 22.6 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ 1,088 Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 In: 10249 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: 1.5 10380' Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 5.8 Dev: FTG: 356 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 6500 Hrs: 24 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6
FPH: 14 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,309

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $1,088 Daily Total: $19,204

6:00 13:30 7:30 DRLG. F/10270' T/10423' 153' 20.4 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

13:30 14:30 1:00 SURVEY g 10380' 1 1/2 Deg. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

13:30 6:00 15:30 DRLG. F/10423' T/10605' 182' 11.7 fph cum.Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 241 LITH: 80% Sandstone - 20% Shale TRIP GAS

SIO 230 FLARE: CONN 2300

ROT. 236 BKGGAS 1700
S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS

3 X/îß GASCO ENERGY
L 1 f-) O DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/6/2004 Days: 24

Depth: 10605' Prog: 335 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 14.6 Formation: Mesa Verde

DMC: $2,309 TMC: $45,476 TDC: $20,292 CWC: $750,599
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 35 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 5/6 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 6/7 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 22.6 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ 1,088 Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 In: 10249 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: 1.5 10380' Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 5.8 Dev: FTG: 356 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 6500 Hrs: 24 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6
FPH: 14 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,309

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 15 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $1,088 Daily Total: $19,204

6:00 13:30 7:30 DRLG. F/10270' T/10423' 153' 20.4 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

13:30 14:30 1:00 SURVEY g 10380' 1 1/2 Deg. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

13:30 6:00 15:30 DRLG. F/10423' T/10605' 182' 11.7 fph cum.Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 241 LITH: 80% Sandstone - 20% Shale TRIP GAS

SIO 230 FLARE: CONN 2300

ROT. 236 BKGGAS 1700
S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS



-rors cros e GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/7/2004 Days: 25

Depth: 10829' Prog: 224 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 9.5 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $2,648 TMC: $48,124 TDC: $46,543 CWC: $797,142
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Location: $ 27,000

VIS: 35 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 6/6 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 8/12 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 20.8 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 10249 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 6 Dev: FTG: 580 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

chis: 10500 Hrs: 48 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.3 FPH: 12.1 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.5 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,648

Ca: 120 wos: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timo Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $46,543

6:00 9:00 3:00 DRLG. F/10605' T/10642' 36' 12 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

9:00 9:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

9:30 6:00 20:30 DRLG. F/10642' T/10829' 187' 9.1 fph Cum. Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 252 LITH: 50% SS - 45% SH - 5% COAL TRIP GAS

S/O 233 FLARE: CONN 2400

ROT. 242 BKGGAS 2400

S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS

-rors cros e GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/7/2004 Days: 25

Depth: 10829' Prog: 224 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 9.5 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $2,648 TMC: $48,124 TDC: $46,543 CWC: $797,142
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Location: $ 27,000

VIS: 35 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 6/6 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 8/12 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 20.8 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 weliHead: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 10249 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 6 Dev: FTG: 580 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

chis: 10500 Hrs: 48 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.3 FPH: 12.1 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.5 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,648

Ca: 120 wos: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timo Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $46,543

6:00 9:00 3:00 DRLG. F/10605' T/10642' 36' 12 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

9:00 9:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

9:30 6:00 20:30 DRLG. F/10642' T/10829' 187' 9.1 fph Cum. Bits: $ 30,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 252 LITH: 50% SS - 45% SH - 5% COAL TRIP GAS

S/O 233 FLARE: CONN 2400

ROT. 242 BKGGAS 2400

S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS



0 361~cris A ME s i A GASCO ENERGY
.7 gg- Jy£ dg DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP IN WITH BIT# 6 Date: 6/8/2004 Days: 26

Depth: 10906' Prog: 77 D Hrs: 13 AV ROP: 5.9 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $3,136 TMC: $51,260 TDC: $37,878 CWC: $835,020
Contractor: Naí·ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.8 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 6 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 35 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 108345 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 6/8 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 7/9 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 10,427

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 DSX 111 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18.4 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 4/14-4/16 Weli Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 10249 10906 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 420

Sand: Tr Dev: 1.75-10850' Out: 10906 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,000

Solids: 7.6 Dev: FTG: 657 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 10500 Hrs: 61 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

Pf/Mf: .4/6.3 FPH: 10.8 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.6 TIBIG: 6/Nll Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,136

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timo Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $37,878

6:00 14:00 8:00 DRLG. F/10829' T/10862' 33' 4.2 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,492

14:00 14:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 34,787

14:30 19:30 5:00 DRLG. F/10862' T/10906' 44' 8.8 fph Cum. Bits: $ 30,700

19:30 20:30 1:00 DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL Rot. Hrs: 430.5

20:30 1:30 5:30 TRIP OUT FOR BIT - NO TIGHT HOLE BIT 77/8 1.10

1:30 2:30 1:00 CHANGE BIT & RECOVER SURVEY (1 3/4 Deg. @ 10850') M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

2:30 6:00 3:30 TRIP IN HOLE SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 255 LITH: 50% SS - 45% SH - 5% COAL TRIP GAS

S/O 240 FLARE: 5' CONN 4000

ROT. 245 BKG GAS 3800
S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS

0 361~cris A ME s i A GASCO ENERGY
.7 gg- Jy£ dg DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP IN WITH BIT# 6 Date: 6/8/2004 Days: 26

Depth: 10906' Prog: 77 D Hrs: 13 AV ROP: 5.9 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $3,136 TMC: $51,260 TDC: $37,878 CWC: $835,020
Contractor: Naí·ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 9.8 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 6 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 35 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 108345 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 6/8 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 7/9 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 10,427

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 DSX 111 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18.4 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 4/14-4/16 Weli Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 10249 10906 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 420

Sand: Tr Dev: 1.75-10850' Out: 10906 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 7,000

Solids: 7.6 Dev: FTG: 657 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 10500 Hrs: 61 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

Pf/Mf: .4/6.3 FPH: 10.8 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.6 TIBIG: 6/Nll Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 3,136

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timo Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $37,878

6:00 14:00 8:00 DRLG. F/10829' T/10862' 33' 4.2 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,492

14:00 14:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 34,787

14:30 19:30 5:00 DRLG. F/10862' T/10906' 44' 8.8 fph Cum. Bits: $ 30,700

19:30 20:30 1:00 DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL Rot. Hrs: 430.5

20:30 1:30 5:30 TRIP OUT FOR BIT - NO TIGHT HOLE BIT 77/8 1.10

1:30 2:30 1:00 CHANGE BIT & RECOVER SURVEY (1 3/4 Deg. @ 10850') M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

2:30 6:00 3:30 TRIP IN HOLE SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 255 LITH: 50% SS - 45% SH - 5% COAL TRIP GAS

S/O 240 FLARE: 5' CONN 4000

ROT. 245 BKG GAS 3800
S.L.SEELY PEAK GAS



GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/9/2004 Days: 27

Depth: 11050' Prog: 144 D Hrs: 20 AV ROP: 7.2 Formation:

DMC: $2,337 TMC: $53,597 TDC: $32,562 CWC: $867,582

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 36 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 8/8 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 8/14 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 11,493

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 10249 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 1,837

Sand: 0.25 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 9 Dev: FTG: 144 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 5000 Hrs: 20 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .3/6.7 FPH: 7.2 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.6 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,337

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $32,562

6:00 6:30 0:30 BREAK CIRC. g 5800' cum.wtr: $ 23,909

6:30 8:30 2:00 TRIP IN TO 10866' Cum. Fuel $ 35,853

8:30 9:30 1:00 BREAK CIRC.& WASH 40' TO BTM. NO FILL cum.Bits: $ 37,000

9:30 11:00 1:30 DRLG. F/10906' T/10940' 34' 22.7 fph Rot. Hrs:

11:00 11:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE BIT 7 7/8 1.10

11:30 6:00 18:30 DRLG. F/10940' T/11050' 110' 5.9 fph M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 251 LITH: 65%Shale - 15% Sandstone - 20% Coal TRIP GAS

SIO 239 FLARE: 10' - 15' CONN 3500

ROT. 245 BKG GAS 2500

S.L.SEELY PEAK

GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/9/2004 Days: 27

Depth: 11050' Prog: 144 D Hrs: 20 AV ROP: 7.2 Formation:

DMC: $2,337 TMC: $53,597 TDC: $32,562 CWC: $867,582

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-l TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 36 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 8/8 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 8/14 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 11,493

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 10249 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 1,837

Sand: 0.25 Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 9 Dev: FTG: 144 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 5000 Hrs: 20 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .3/6.7 FPH: 7.2 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.6 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,337

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $32,562

6:00 6:30 0:30 BREAK CIRC. g 5800' cum.wtr: $ 23,909

6:30 8:30 2:00 TRIP IN TO 10866' Cum. Fuel $ 35,853

8:30 9:30 1:00 BREAK CIRC.& WASH 40' TO BTM. NO FILL cum.Bits: $ 37,000

9:30 11:00 1:30 DRLG. F/10906' T/10940' 34' 22.7 fph Rot. Hrs:

11:00 11:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE BIT 7 7/8 1.10

11:30 6:00 18:30 DRLG. F/10940' T/11050' 110' 5.9 fph M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 251 LITH: 65%Shale - 15% Sandstone - 20% Coal TRIP GAS

SIO 239 FLARE: 10' - 15' CONN 3500

ROT. 245 BKG GAS 2500

S.L.SEELY PEAK



5 rf/TE S / GASCO ENERGY
- Ogt DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/10/2004 Days: 28

Depth: 11194' Prog: 144 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 6.1 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $2,082 TMC: $55,679 TDC: $18,977 CWC: $886,559
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 37 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 8/8 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 9/14 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18.8 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 10906 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10 Dev: FTG: 288 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 8000 Hrs: 43 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/6.4 FPH: 6.6 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.8 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,082

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Doun: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $18,977

6:00 10:00 4:00 DRLG. F/11050' T/11078' 28' 7 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

10:30 6:00 19:30 DRLG. F/11078' T/11194' 116' 6 fph cum.Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 258 LITH: 75%Shale - 20% Sandstone - 5% Coal TRIP GAS

S/O 246 FLARE: CONN 3500

ROT. 250 BKG GAS 3000
S.L.SEELY PEAK

5 rf/TE S / GASCO ENERGY
- Ogt DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/10/2004 Days: 28

Depth: 11194' Prog: 144 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 6.1 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $2,082 TMC: $55,679 TDC: $18,977 CWC: $886,559
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 37 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 8/8 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 9/14 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 18.8 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 10906 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10 Dev: FTG: 288 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 8000 Hrs: 43 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/6.4 FPH: 6.6 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.8 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,082

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Doun: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $18,977

6:00 10:00 4:00 DRLG. F/11050' T/11078' 28' 7 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

10:00 10:30 0:30 RIG SERVICE Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

10:30 6:00 19:30 DRLG. F/11078' T/11194' 116' 6 fph cum.Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 258 LITH: 75%Shale - 20% Sandstone - 5% Coal TRIP GAS

S/O 246 FLARE: CONN 3500

ROT. 250 BKG GAS 3000
S.L.SEELY PEAK



/72 Soi $ GASCO ENERGY
3ŸË OÑ DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/11/2004 Days: 29

Depth: 11312' Prog: 118 D Hrs: 24 AV ROP: 4.9 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $2,229 TMC: $57,908 TDC: $19,574 CWC: $906,133

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 40 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 450

PVlYP: 10/13 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 9/13 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14.4 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 10906 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10 Dev: FTG: 406 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 7000 Hrs: 67 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.9 FPH: 6 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.9 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,229

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Doun: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $19,574

6:00 6:00 24:00 DRLG. F/11194' T/11312' 118' 4.9 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

cum.Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs: 498

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 260 LITH: 70% Shale 20% Sandstone 5% Coal 5% LCM TRIP GAS

SIO 250 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 2500

ROT. 255 BKG GAS 2000

S.L.SEELY PEAK

/72 Soi $ GASCO ENERGY
3ŸË OÑ DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/11/2004 Days: 29

Depth: 11312' Prog: 118 D Hrs: 24 AV ROP: 4.9 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $2,229 TMC: $57,908 TDC: $19,574 CWC: $906,133

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 40 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 450

PVlYP: 10/13 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 9/13 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14.4 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 10906 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10 Dev: FTG: 406 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 7000 Hrs: 67 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.9 FPH: 6 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.9 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,229

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Doun: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $19,574

6:00 6:00 24:00 DRLG. F/11194' T/11312' 118' 4.9 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

cum.Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs: 498

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 260 LITH: 70% Shale 20% Sandstone 5% Coal 5% LCM TRIP GAS

SIO 250 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 2500

ROT. 255 BKG GAS 2000

S.L.SEELY PEAK



e GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

03 9
Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/12/2004 Days: 30

Depth: 11400' Prog: 88 D Hrs: 21 AV ROP: 4.2 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $2,293 TMC: $60,201 TDC: $19,798 CWC: $925,931
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-1 TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.2 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 43 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 13/11 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 10/15 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12.8 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 In: 10906 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 9.8 Dev: FTG: 494 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

chis: 9000 Hrs: 88 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/7.1 FPH: 5.6 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 6.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,293

Ca: 120 wos: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 610

Time Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $19,798

6:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG. F/11312' Tl11354' 42' 6.4 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

12:30 14:30 2:00 WORK ON MUD PUMPS Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

14:30 17:30 3:00 DRLG. F/11354' T/11365' 11' 3.7 fph cum.Bits: $ 37,000

17:30 18:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE Rot. Hrs: 519

18:00 23:30 5:30 DRLG. F/11365' T/11377' 12' 2.2 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

23:30 0:00 0:30 WORK ON MUD PUMPS M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

0:00 6:00 6:00 DRLG. F/11377' T/11400' 23' 3.8 fph SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 265 LITH: 80% Sandstone 15% Shale 5% Coal TRIP GAS

SIO 250 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 2500

ROT. 255 BKG GAS 2200
S.L.SEELY PEAK

e GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

03 9
Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/12/2004 Days: 30

Depth: 11400' Prog: 88 D Hrs: 21 AV ROP: 4.2 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $2,293 TMC: $60,201 TDC: $19,798 CWC: $925,931
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-1 TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.2 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 43 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 13/11 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 10/15 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12.8 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 In: 10906 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 9.8 Dev: FTG: 494 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

chis: 9000 Hrs: 88 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/7.1 FPH: 5.6 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 6.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,293

Ca: 120 wos: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 610

Time Break Down: RPM: 55 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $19,798

6:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG. F/11312' Tl11354' 42' 6.4 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

12:30 14:30 2:00 WORK ON MUD PUMPS Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

14:30 17:30 3:00 DRLG. F/11354' T/11365' 11' 3.7 fph cum.Bits: $ 37,000

17:30 18:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE Rot. Hrs: 519

18:00 23:30 5:30 DRLG. F/11365' T/11377' 12' 2.2 fph BIT 7 7/8 1.10

23:30 0:00 0:30 WORK ON MUD PUMPS M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

0:00 6:00 6:00 DRLG. F/11377' T/11400' 23' 3.8 fph SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 265 LITH: 80% Sandstone 15% Shale 5% Coal TRIP GAS

SIO 250 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 2500

ROT. 255 BKG GAS 2200
S.L.SEELY PEAK



/f /7 GASCO ENERGY
/bd DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP INWITH BIT#6 Date: 6/13/2004 Days: 31

Depth: 11436' Prog: 36 D Hrs: 9.5 AV ROP: 3.9 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $461 TMC: $60,662 TDC: $17,948 CWC: $943,879

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.2 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 43 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 JT 1699 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 13/11 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 10/15 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12.8 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 TFA 1.2 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 In: 10906 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: 11436 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 9.8 Dev: FTG: 530 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 9000 Hrs: 98 separator: $ - corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/7.1 FPH: 5.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 6.3 TIBIG: 4 n/a 1/2" Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 461

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 592

Time Break Down: RPM: 55 I 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $17,948

6:00 15:30 9:30 DRLG. F/11400' T/11436' 36' 3.9 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

15:30 16:00 0:30 DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

16:00 0:30 8:30 TRIP OUT FOR BIT ( SLM ) NO TIGHT HOLE Cum. Bits: $ 37,000

0:30 2:30 2:00 CHANGE BIT & MOTOR Rot. Hrs:

2:30 6:00 3:30 TRIP IN HOLE BIT 77/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 265 LITH: 80% Sandstone 15% Shale 5% Coal TRIP GAS

SIO 250 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 2500

ROT. 255 BKG GAS 2200

S.L.SEELY PEAK

/f /7 GASCO ENERGY
/bd DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP INWITH BIT#6 Date: 6/13/2004 Days: 31

Depth: 11436' Prog: 36 D Hrs: 9.5 AV ROP: 3.9 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $461 TMC: $60,662 TDC: $17,948 CWC: $943,879

Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.2 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 6 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 43 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 JT 1699 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 13/11 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 10/15 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12.8 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 TFA 1.2 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 In: 10906 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: 11436 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 9.8 Dev: FTG: 530 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 9000 Hrs: 98 separator: $ - corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/7.1 FPH: 5.4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 6.3 TIBIG: 4 n/a 1/2" Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 461

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 592

Time Break Down: RPM: 55 I 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $17,948

6:00 15:30 9:30 DRLG. F/11400' T/11436' 36' 3.9 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

15:30 16:00 0:30 DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

16:00 0:30 8:30 TRIP OUT FOR BIT ( SLM ) NO TIGHT HOLE Cum. Bits: $ 37,000

0:30 2:30 2:00 CHANGE BIT & MOTOR Rot. Hrs:

2:30 6:00 3:30 TRIP IN HOLE BIT 77/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 265 LITH: 80% Sandstone 15% Shale 5% Coal TRIP GAS

SIO 250 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 2500

ROT. 255 BKG GAS 2200

S.L.SEELY PEAK



of3 /î¿ 99j GASCO ENERGY
L DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/14/2004 Days: 32

Depth: 11500' Prog: 64 D Hrs: 16 AV ROP: 4 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $573 TMC: $61,235 TDC: $17,468 CWC: $961,347

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.3 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 6 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 43 Stroke: 10 SIN: JT 1699 Surf. csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 12/13 SPM: 92 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 10/15 Press: 1650 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 414 Type: ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12.8 Nv: 131 Jets: TFA 1.2 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: 1.75 11400 Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10 Dev: FTG: 64 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 9000 Hrs: 16 Separator: $ - corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/7.1 FPH: 4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.7 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 573

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Dor.in: RPM: 377 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $17,468

6:00 10:00 4:00 TRIP INTO 11338' cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

10:00 10:30 0:30 BREAK CIRC. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

10:30 14:00 3:30 WASH & REAM F/11338' Tl11436' - TD cum.Bits: $ 37,000

14:00 6:00 16:00 DRLG. F/11436' T/11500' 64' 4 fph Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9,79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 265 LITH: TRIP GAS 4200

SIO 245 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 3000

ROT. 255 BKG GAS 3000

S.L.SEELY PEAK

of3 /î¿ 99j GASCO ENERGY
L DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/14/2004 Days: 32

Depth: 11500' Prog: 64 D Hrs: 16 AV ROP: 4 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $573 TMC: $61,235 TDC: $17,468 CWC: $961,347

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.3 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 6 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 43 Stroke: 10 SIN: JT 1699 Surf. csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 12/13 SPM: 92 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 10/15 Press: 1650 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 414 Type: ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 12.8 Nv: 131 Jets: TFA 1.2 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: 1.75 11400 Out: Packers: $ - Bits / Corehead: $ -

Solids: 10 Dev: FTG: 64 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 9000 Hrs: 16 Separator: $ - corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/7.1 FPH: 4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.7 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 573

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Dor.in: RPM: 377 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $17,468

6:00 10:00 4:00 TRIP INTO 11338' cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

10:00 10:30 0:30 BREAK CIRC. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

10:30 14:00 3:30 WASH & REAM F/11338' Tl11436' - TD cum.Bits: $ 37,000

14:00 6:00 16:00 DRLG. F/11436' T/11500' 64' 4 fph Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9,79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 265 LITH: TRIP GAS 4200

SIO 245 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 3000

ROT. 255 BKG GAS 3000

S.L.SEELY PEAK



0 42 5 /M 59/ GAsco ENERGY
'3 7'£'gi DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/15/2004 Days: 33

Depth: 11600' Prog: 100 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 4.3 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $459 TMC: $61,694 TDC: $17,354 CWC: $978,701

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.2 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 37 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 8/9 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 8/12 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 16.8 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Weli Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 9.8 Dev: FTG: 164 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 9000 Hrs: 39 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/6.7 FPH: 4.2 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.8 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 459

Ca: 120 woB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 377 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $17,354

6:00 15:30 9:30 DRLG. F/11500' T/11535' 35' 3.7 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

15:30 16:30 1:00 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 24,360

16:30 6:00 13:30 DRLG. F/11535' T/11600' 65' 4.8 fph cum.Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 265 LITH: INTERBEDDED SAND & SHALE TRIP GAS

SIO 245 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 4000

ROT. 255 BKG GAS 4000

S.L.SEELY PEAK

0 42 5 /M 59/ GAsco ENERGY
'3 7'£'gi DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/15/2004 Days: 33

Depth: 11600' Prog: 100 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 4.3 Formation: Lower Mesa Verde

DMC: $459 TMC: $61,694 TDC: $17,354 CWC: $978,701

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.2 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 37 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 8/9 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 8/12 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 16.8 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Weli Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 9.8 Dev: FTG: 164 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 9000 Hrs: 39 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/6.7 FPH: 4.2 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.8 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 459

Ca: 120 woB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 377 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $17,354

6:00 15:30 9:30 DRLG. F/11500' T/11535' 35' 3.7 fph cum.wtr: $ 22,072

15:30 16:30 1:00 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuei $ 24,360

16:30 6:00 13:30 DRLG. F/11535' T/11600' 65' 4.8 fph cum.Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 265 LITH: INTERBEDDED SAND & SHALE TRIP GAS

SIO 245 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 4000

ROT. 255 BKG GAS 4000

S.L.SEELY PEAK



GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/16/2004 Days: 34

Depth: 11707' Prog: 107 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 4.6 Formation: Castlegate

DMC: $4,146 TMC: $65,840 TDC: $40,231 CWC: $1,018,932

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.3 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 40 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 450

PVlYP: 10/12 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 8/12 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 16 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 In: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 8,719

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 9,000

Solids: 10 Dev: FTG: 271 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 9000 Hrs: 62 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.9
FPH: 4.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.9 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,146

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,021

Timo Break Down: RPM: 377 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $40,231

6:00 17:30 11:30 DRLG. F/11600' T/11665' 65' 5.6 fph cum.wtr: $ 30,791

17:30 18:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 24,360

18:00 6:00 12:00 DRLG. F/11665' T/11707' 42' 3.5 fph cum.Bits: $ 46,000

Rot. Hrs: 591

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 0 LITH: 70% SHALE 20% SANDSTONE 5% COAL TRIP GAS

S/O O FLARE: 10' 20' CONN 5500

ROT. O BKGGAS 5500

S.L.SEELY PEAK

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/16/2004 Days: 34

Depth: 11707' Prog: 107 D Hrs: 23.5 AV ROP: 4.6 Formation: Castlegate

DMC: $4,146 TMC: $65,840 TDC: $40,231 CWC: $1,018,932

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.3 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 5 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 40 Stroke: 10 SIN: 108184 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 450

PVlYP: 10/12 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 8/12 Press: 1550 MFG: HYC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: DSX 199 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 16 NV: 131 Jets: 3/14-3/18 Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 In: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 8,719

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 9,000

Solids: 10 Dev: FTG: 271 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 9000 Hrs: 62 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.9
FPH: 4.3 Heater: $ - consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.9 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 4,146

Ca: 120 WOB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 1,021

Timo Break Down: RPM: 377 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $40,231

6:00 17:30 11:30 DRLG. F/11600' T/11665' 65' 5.6 fph cum.wtr: $ 30,791

17:30 18:00 0:30 RIG SERVICE cum.Fuel $ 24,360

18:00 6:00 12:00 DRLG. F/11665' T/11707' 42' 3.5 fph cum.Bits: $ 46,000

Rot. Hrs: 591

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 0 LITH: 70% SHALE 20% SANDSTONE 5% COAL TRIP GAS

S/O O FLARE: 10' 20' CONN 5500

ROT. O BKGGAS 5500

S.L.SEELY PEAK



GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

044
Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/17/2004 Days: 35

Depth: 11782' Prog: 75 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 3.3 Formation: Castlegate

DMC: $1,632 TMC: $67,472 TDC: $24,177 CWC: $1,043,109

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 42 Stroke: 10 SIN: JT 1699 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 12/14 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 12/16 Press: 1550 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 5,650

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 16.6 NV: 131 Jets: TFA 1.2 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 11 Dev: FTG: 345 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 9000 Hrs: 85 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/6.6 FPH: 4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.6 TIBIG: 10 / 20 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,632

Ca: 120 Wos: 377 / 56 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $24,177

6:00 22:30 16:30 DRLG. F/11707' T/11769' 62' 3.8 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

22:30 23:30 1:00 RIG REPEAIR # 3 RIG MOTOR Cum. Fuel $ 30,010

23:30 6:00 6:30 DRLG. F/11769' T/11782' 13' 2 fph cum.Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 265 LITH: 70% Shale - 25% Sandstone - 5% Coal D.T. GAS 6500

S/O 245 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 5000

ROT. 255 BKGGAS 4500

S.L.SEELY PEAK

GASCO ENERGY
DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

044
Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: DRLG. Date: 6/17/2004 Days: 35

Depth: 11782' Prog: 75 D Hrs: 23 AV ROP: 3.3 Formation: Castlegate

DMC: $1,632 TMC: $67,472 TDC: $24,177 CWC: $1,043,109

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.5 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 42 Stroke: 10 SIN: JT 1699 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 12/14 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 12/16 Press: 1550 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ 5,650

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 16.6 NV: 131 Jets: TFA 1.2 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 11 Dev: FTG: 345 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 9000 Hrs: 85 1/2 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .5/6.6 FPH: 4 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.6 TIBIG: 10 / 20 Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 1,632

Ca: 120 Wos: 377 / 56 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Time Break Down: RPM: Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $24,177

6:00 22:30 16:30 DRLG. F/11707' T/11769' 62' 3.8 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

22:30 23:30 1:00 RIG REPEAIR # 3 RIG MOTOR Cum. Fuel $ 30,010

23:30 6:00 6:30 DRLG. F/11769' T/11782' 13' 2 fph cum.Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 265 LITH: 70% Shale - 25% Sandstone - 5% Coal D.T. GAS 6500

S/O 245 FLARE: 5' - 15' CONN 5000

ROT. 255 BKGGAS 4500

S.L.SEELY PEAK



7'a is MN g GASCO ENERGY
-/ - 36/ Ú DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: LOGGING Date: 6/18/2004 Days: 36

Depth: 11800' Prog: 18 D Hrs: 6.5 AV ROP: 2.8 Formation: Castlegate

DMC: $2,025 TMC: $69,497 TDC: $53,920 CWC: $1,097,029

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.7 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 40 Stroke: 10 SIN: JT 1699 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 12/11 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 7/12 Press: 1550 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 NV: 131 Jets: TFA 1.2 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: 11800 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 35,000

Solids: 12 Dev: FTG: 364 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 10000 Hrs: 92 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.1 FPH: 3.9 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,025

Ca: 1200 wos: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 377 I 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $53,920

6:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG. F/11782' T/11800' 18' 2.8 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

12:30 13:00 0:30 CIRC. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

13:00 16:00 3:00 SHORT TRIP 20 STDS. NO TIGHT HOLE cum.Bits: $ 72,000

16:00 18:30 2:30 CIRC. & COND FOR LOGS Rot. Hrs:

18:30 19:00 0:30 DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL BIT 7 7/8 1.10

19:00 3:00 8:00 TRIP OUT TO LOG M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

3:00 4:00 1:00 LAY DOWN MUD MOTOR & SHOCK SUB SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

4:00 6:00 2:00 RIG UP & RUN IN WITH SCHLUMBERGER PLATFORM EXPRESS 24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 0 LITH: TRIP GAS

SIO 0 FLARE: CONN

ROT. O BKG GAS

S.L.SEELY PEAK

7'a is MN g GASCO ENERGY
-/ - 36/ Ú DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: LOGGING Date: 6/18/2004 Days: 36

Depth: 11800' Prog: 18 D Hrs: 6.5 AV ROP: 2.8 Formation: Castlegate

DMC: $2,025 TMC: $69,497 TDC: $53,920 CWC: $1,097,029

Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.7 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 40 Stroke: 10 SIN: JT 1699 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVlYP: 12/11 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 7/12 Press: 1550 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 NV: 131 Jets: TFA 1.2 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: 11800 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ 35,000

Solids: 12 Dev: FTG: 364 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 10000 Hrs: 92 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.1 FPH: 3.9 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 2,025

Ca: 1200 wos: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 377 I 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ 2,500

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $53,920

6:00 12:30 6:30 DRLG. F/11782' T/11800' 18' 2.8 fph cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

12:30 13:00 0:30 CIRC. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

13:00 16:00 3:00 SHORT TRIP 20 STDS. NO TIGHT HOLE cum.Bits: $ 72,000

16:00 18:30 2:30 CIRC. & COND FOR LOGS Rot. Hrs:

18:30 19:00 0:30 DROP SURVEY & PUMP PILL BIT 7 7/8 1.10

19:00 3:00 8:00 TRIP OUT TO LOG M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

3:00 4:00 1:00 LAY DOWN MUD MOTOR & SHOCK SUB SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

4:00 6:00 2:00 RIG UP & RUN IN WITH SCHLUMBERGER PLATFORM EXPRESS 24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 0 LITH: TRIP GAS

SIO 0 FLARE: CONN

ROT. O BKG GAS

S.L.SEELY PEAK



GASCO ENERGY
/ DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP IN TO COND, FOR CSG. Date: 6/19/2004 Days: 37

Depth: 11800' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0 Formation: Castlegate

DMC: $0 TMC: $69,497 TDC: $59,705 CWC: $1,156,734
Contractor: Nat -ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.7 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 40 stroke: 10 SIN: JT 1699 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 12/11 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 7/12 Press: 2100 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 NV: 131 Jets: TFA 1.2 Well Head: $ - Logging: $ 45,275

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: 11800 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 12 Dev: FTG: 364 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 10000 Hrs: 92 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.1 FPH: 3.9 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: 1200 wos: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 610

Timt Break Down: RPM: 377 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $59,705

6:00 1:00 19:00 LOGGING WITH SCHLUMBERGER RAN PEX-AITH-FBST-GR-FMI cum.wtr: $ 22,072

1:00 6:00 5:00 TRIP INTO COND. FOR 4 1/2" CSG. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

Cum. Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 0 LITH: TRIP GAS

SIO O FLARE: CONN

ROT. O BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK

GASCO ENERGY
/ DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: TRIP IN TO COND, FOR CSG. Date: 6/19/2004 Days: 37

Depth: 11800' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0 Formation: Castlegate

DMC: $0 TMC: $69,497 TDC: $59,705 CWC: $1,156,734
Contractor: Nat -ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.7 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 40 stroke: 10 SIN: JT 1699 Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 12/11 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 7/12 Press: 2100 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 NV: 131 Jets: TFA 1.2 Well Head: $ - Logging: $ 45,275

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: 11800 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 12 Dev: FTG: 364 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: 10000 Hrs: 92 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.1 FPH: 3.9 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.3 TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: 1200 wos: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 610

Timt Break Down: RPM: 377 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $59,705

6:00 1:00 19:00 LOGGING WITH SCHLUMBERGER RAN PEX-AITH-FBST-GR-FMI cum.wtr: $ 22,072

1:00 6:00 5:00 TRIP INTO COND. FOR 4 1/2" CSG. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

Cum. Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs:

BIT 7 7/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 0 LITH: TRIP GAS

SIO O FLARE: CONN

ROT. O BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK



GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT0 4 7

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: RUNNING4 1/2" CSG. Date: 6/20/2004 Days: 38

Depth: 11800' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0 Formation:

DMC: $690 TMC: $70,187 TDC: $15,085 CWC: $1,171,819
Contractor: Nat·ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.7 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 40 Stroke: 10 SIN: JT 1699 Surf. csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 12/11 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 7/12 Press: 1550 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 NV: 131 Jets: TFA 1.2 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: 11800 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 12 Dev: FTG: 364 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 10000 Hrs: 92 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.1 FPH: 3.9 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.3 TIBIG: 5 - n/a - I Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 690

Ca: 1200 woB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 377 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $15,085

6:00 10:00 4:00 TRIP INTO T.D. 11800' cum.wtr: $ 22,072

10:00 12:00 2:00 CIRC. & COND. FOR 4 1/2" CSG. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

12:00 1:00 13:00 LAYDOWN D.P. & D.C. cum.Bits: $ 37,000

1:00 1:30 0:30 PULL WEAR BUSHING Rot. Hrs:

1:30 6:00 4:30 RUN 4 1/2" PROD. CSG. WITH T&MCASERS BIT 77/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 0 LITH: TRIP GAS

SIO O FLARE: CONN

ROT. O BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK

GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT0 4 7

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: RUNNING4 1/2" CSG. Date: 6/20/2004 Days: 38

Depth: 11800' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0 Formation:

DMC: $690 TMC: $70,187 TDC: $15,085 CWC: $1,171,819
Contractor: Nat·ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: 10.7 Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: 7 Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: 40 Stroke: 10 SIN: JT 1699 Surf. csg: $ - Trucking: $ -

PVIYP: 12/11 SPM: 107 Size: 7 7/8" int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: 7/12 Press: 1550 MFG: STC Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: 8 GPM: 438 Type: ER 2142 Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ -

WL: 14 NV: 131 Jets: TFA 1.2 Weil Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: 1 AV: 223 / 333 in: 11436 TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Tr Dev: Out: 11800 Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: 12 Dev: FTG: 364 Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: 10000 Hrs: 92 Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: .4/6.1 FPH: 3.9 Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: 5.3 TIBIG: 5 - n/a - I Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ 690

Ca: 1200 woB: 10 / 20 Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: 377 / 56 Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $15,085

6:00 10:00 4:00 TRIP INTO T.D. 11800' cum.wtr: $ 22,072

10:00 12:00 2:00 CIRC. & COND. FOR 4 1/2" CSG. Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

12:00 1:00 13:00 LAYDOWN D.P. & D.C. cum.Bits: $ 37,000

1:00 1:30 0:30 PULL WEAR BUSHING Rot. Hrs:

1:30 6:00 4:30 RUN 4 1/2" PROD. CSG. WITH T&MCASERS BIT 77/8 1.10

M MOTOR 6 1/4 33.12

SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

TOTAL BHA 782.84

P/U 0 LITH: TRIP GAS

SIO O FLARE: CONN

ROT. O BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK



« sai O GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: RIG DOWN Date: 6/21/2004 Days: 39

Depth: 11800' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0 Formation:

DMC: TMC: $70,187 TDC: $117,266 CWC: $1,289,085
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 1,650

PVlYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ 81,430

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 19,791

Timt Break Down: RPM: Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $117,266

6:00 12:00 6:00 RAN 276 Jts. 4 1/2" 13.5# P-110 LT&CWITH FLOAT SHOE & cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

COLLAR TOTAL 11800.60' - SHOE SET g 11798' cum.Fuel $ 24,360

12:00 14:30 2:30 CIRC. & COND FOR CMT. cum.Bits: $ 37,000

14:30 15:00 0:30 SAFTEY MEETING Rot. Hrs:

15:00 18:00 3:00 CMT. WITH SCHLUMBERGER PUMPED 20 BBL CW-100 20 BBL BIT 77/8 1.10

WATER, LEAD : 305 Sks Hi-Lift WT.11.5 YIELD3.05 165 BBL M MOTOR 61/4 33.12

TAIT:2563 Sks. 50/50 POZ "G" WT. 14.1 YIELD 1.28 584 BBL SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

DROP PLUG & DISP WITH 175 BBL 3% KCL - PLUG BUMPED 24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

FLOATS HELD - FULL RETURNS - WAS RECIPROCATED

CSG. LANDED WITH 125,000#

18:00 1:00 7:00 CLEAN MUD TANKS

1:00 6:00 5:00 RIG DOWN

RIG RELEASED g 1:00 AM 6/21/04

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 0 LITH: TRIP GAS

SIO O FLARE: CONN

ROT. O BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK

« sai O GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: RIG DOWN Date: 6/21/2004 Days: 39

Depth: 11800' Prog: 0 D Hrs: 0 AV ROP: 0 Formation:

DMC: TMC: $70,187 TDC: $117,266 CWC: $1,289,085
Contractor: Nat ors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 1,650

PVlYP: SPM: Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig cost: $ 11,000

Gel: Press: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: Type: Float Equp: $ - Cement: $ 81,430

WL: NV: Jets: Well Head: $ - Mud Logger: $ 575

Cake: AV: In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ -

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chls: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion: $ 85

PflMf: FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 19,791

Timt Break Down: RPM: Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $0 Daily Total: $117,266

6:00 12:00 6:00 RAN 276 Jts. 4 1/2" 13.5# P-110 LT&CWITH FLOAT SHOE & cum.Wtr: $ 22,072

COLLAR TOTAL 11800.60' - SHOE SET g 11798' cum.Fuel $ 24,360

12:00 14:30 2:30 CIRC. & COND FOR CMT. cum.Bits: $ 37,000

14:30 15:00 0:30 SAFTEY MEETING Rot. Hrs:

15:00 18:00 3:00 CMT. WITH SCHLUMBERGER PUMPED 20 BBL CW-100 20 BBL BIT 77/8 1.10

WATER, LEAD : 305 Sks Hi-Lift WT.11.5 YIELD3.05 165 BBL M MOTOR 61/4 33.12

TAIT:2563 Sks. 50/50 POZ "G" WT. 14.1 YIELD 1.28 584 BBL SHOCK 6 1/4 9.79

DROP PLUG & DISP WITH 175 BBL 3% KCL - PLUG BUMPED 24 - DC 6 1/4 738.83

FLOATS HELD - FULL RETURNS - WAS RECIPROCATED

CSG. LANDED WITH 125,000#

18:00 1:00 7:00 CLEAN MUD TANKS

1:00 6:00 5:00 RIG DOWN

RIG RELEASED g 1:00 AM 6/21/04

TOTAL BHA 782.84

PIU 0 LITH: TRIP GAS

SIO O FLARE: CONN

ROT. O BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK



GASCO ENERGY
DAILYDRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

4 4 9
Well: Fed. 11-22-9-19 OPR: RIG UP Date: 6/21/2004 Days:

Depth: Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation:

DMC: TMC: TDC: $96,150 CWC: $96,150
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: #1 6.5X10 Bit#: Conductor: $ - Loc,Cost: $ 39,557

VIS: SPM: Size: Surf. Csg: $ - Rig Move: $ -

PVlYP: #2 6.5X11 Type: Int. Csg: $ - Conductor: $ 28,300

Gel: SPM: MFG: Prod Csg: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,200

ph: GPM: SIN: Float Equp: $ - Trucking: $ -

WL: Press: Jets: Well Head: $ - Water: $ 6,675

Cake: AV DC: In: TBGIRods: $ - Fuel: $ 8,685

Sand: AV DP: Out: Packers: $ - Mud Logger: $ -

Solids: FTG: Tanks: $ - Logging: $ -

Chls: Hrs: Separator: $ - Cement: $ 6,272

PflMf: FPH: Heater: $ - Bits: $ -

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Corrosion: $ -

Timt Break Down: RPM: Misc: $ - Consultant: $ 825

START END TIME Rot. Hrs: Daily Total: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

RIG 100% ON LOC. & 90% RIGGED UP IF WE GET #3 MOTOR Misc.ILabor: $ 4,636

FlXED WE CAN SPUD FRI.6/25 $ -

Daily Total: $ 96,150

Cum. Wtr: $ 6,675

Cum. Fuel

Cum. Bits:

BHA

BlT 12.25"

MOTOR 8"

NRS 12.25"

SHOCK 8"

NRS 12.25"

3-DC 8"

CIO 8"

24 - DC 6.25"

TOTAL BHA

Survey

Survey

PIU 0 LITH: BKG GAS

SIO O FLARE: CONN GAS

ROT. O TRIP GAS

FUEL Used: On Hand: S.L.SEELY PEAK
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s e GASCO ENERGY
- 3Ÿ'ËØ DAILY DRILLINGAND COMPLETION REPORT

Well: FED. 11-21-9-19 OPR: COST UP DATE Date: 6/22/2004 Days: 40

Depth: Prog: D Hrs: AV ROP: Formation:
DMC: TMC: $70,187 TDC: $145,788 CWC: $1,434,873
Contractor: Nabors # 924 Mud Co: M-I TANGIBLE INTANGIBLE

MW: Liner: 6 1/2 Bit #: Conductor: $ - Rig Move: $ -

VIS: Stroke: 10 SIN: Surf. Csg: $ - Trucking: $ 3,000

PVlYP: SPM: 107 Size: Int. Csg: $ - Rig Cost: $ -

Gel: Press: 1550 MFG: Prod Csg: $ 126,378 Fuel: $ -

ph: GPM: 438 Type: Float Equp: $ 2,000 Cement: $ -

WL: NV: 131 Jets: Well Head: $ 600 Mud Logger: $ -

Cake: AV: 223 / 333 In: TBGIRods: $ - Water: $ 3,769

Sand: Dev: Out: Packers: $ - Bits I Corehead: $ -

Solids: Dev: FTG: Tanks: $ - Rental Tools: $ 1,910

Chis: Hrs: Separator: $ - Corrosion:

PflMf: FPH: Heater: $ - Consultant: $ 825

Dapp ppb: TIBIG: Pumping LIT: $ - Drilling Mud: $ -

Ca: WOB: Prime Mover: $ - Misc. I Labor: $ 7,306

Timt Break Dovm: RPM: Misc: $ - Mud Motors: $ -

START END TIME BHA: Daily Total: $128,978 Daily Total: $16,810

Cum. Wtr: $ 25,841

Cum. Fuel $ 24,360

Cum. Bits: $ 37,000

Rot. Hrs:

TOTAL BHA 0.00

PIU 0 LITH: TRIP GAS
SIO O FLARE: CONN

ROT. O BKG GAS
S.L.SEELY PEAK
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Uni d States Department of the nterior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT TA e paine
Utah State Office IN Mgg|CA
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155
http://www.blm.gov

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3106
(UT-924)

May 18, 2004

Memorandum

To: Vernal Field Office, Moab Field Office

From: Chief, Branch of Minerals Adjudication

Subject; Name Change Approval

Attached is an approved copy of the name change recognized by the Utah State Office. We have
updated our records to reflect the name change from Pannonian Energy Inc., into Gasco
Production Company is effective February 24, 2004.

is/Robert Lages

Robert Lopez
Chief Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. State of Utan Certificate of Registration

cc: . MMS, Reference Data Branch, James Sykes, PO Box'25165, Denver CO 80225
State of Utah, DOGM, Attn: Earlene Russell, PO Box 145801, SLC UT 84114 RECElVED
Teyesa Thompson
Jod Incardine gg gg 200(
Connie Seare

DN.OFOIL,GAS °
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ACF 1

'The frst tate

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, ËEÇRETARY OF STATZ OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO RE1pi'BY CERTIFY THE ATTACBEÔIS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF TEE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT OF "PANNONIAN ENERGY INC.",

CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "PANNONIAN ENERGY INC." TO "GASCO

PRODUCTION COMPANY", FILED IN THIS OFFICE Ohí THE TWENTY-FOURTH

DAY OF FEBRUARY, A.D. 2004, AT 12:43 O'CLOCK P.M.

A FILED COPY OF THIS CERTIFICATE BAS BEZN FORWARDED TO TBE

NEW CASTLE COUNTY RECORDZR OF DEEDS .

Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

2899291 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 2963993

040133641 DATE:
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O O
Gasco Production

api twsp rng sec well_name lease_ num stat la_pa

4304734168 0908 190E 20 FED 24-20-9-19 UTU-75090 DRL

4304734169 090S 190E 20 FED 44-20-9-19 UTU-75090 DRL

4304734199 090S 190E 21 FED 23-21-9-19 UTU-78433 P

4304734608 090S 190E 21 FED 11-21-9-19 UTU-78433 DRL

4304735405 090S 190E 21 FED 42-21-9-19 UTU-78433 APD

4304735606 090S 190E 21 FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 UTU-78433 APD

4304734607 090S 190E 22 LYTHAMFED 22-22-9-19 UTU-78433 P

4304735404 090S 190E 22 FED 11-22-9-19 UTU-78433 DRL

4304733653 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 31-29 UTU-76262 P

4304733750 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 34-29 UTU-76034 P

4304734111 090S 190E 29 FEDERAL 23-29 #1 UTU-76262 P

4304734202 090S 190E 29 FED 42-29-9-19 UTU-76262 P

4304735343 090S 190E 30 FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 UTU-37246 DRL

4304734201 090S 190E 31 FED 32-31-9-19 UTU-76489 P

4304735623 090S 190E 31 FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 UTU-019880A APD

4304735624 090S 190E 31 FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 UTU-019880A APD

4304734286 100S 170E 12 PETES WASH 23-12 #1 UTU-77063 P

4301332560 100S 170E 17 WILKINRIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 UTU-043615 APD

4304734551 100S 170E 24 FED 43-24-3 #1 UTU-74401 P

4304733983 100S 180E 07 FEDERAL 24-7 #1 UTU-68387 P

4304734539 100S 180E 18 FED 14-18-2 #1 UTU-74971 P

4304735808 100S 180E 22 FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 UTU-018260A APD

4304734924 100S 180E 30 FED 22-30-10-18 UTU-74408 APD

4304734813 100S 190E 06 FED 21-6-10-19 UTU-76490 LA 3/30/2004

4304731178 110S 200E 03 LAFKAS FED 1-3 U-34350 S

4304731818 110S 200E 05 WILLOW CREEK UNIT 2 U-39223 TA

4304731026 110S 200E 10 HILLFEDERAL 1-10 U-44089 TA
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co ENERGY - F€d€TRI 11-Zi-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T95, R19E

Uintah County, Utah ys-oW. 3¥ bo5Û$$ DAILY COAfPLETION REPORT

4/7/04 Huffman Enterprises building rd into loc. (SCE)

4/12/04 Rd work 90% finished. MI D-8 cat to build loc. (SCE)

4/15/04 Loc finished and still working on reserve pit. Haven't had to blast to build loc. (SCE)

4/20/04 Finishing loc and pit today. Had to blast bottom of pit to get deep enough. (SCE)

4/23/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout rathole rig. Spudded well 9:00 AM 4/22/04. Ran 17 ¼'
hammer bit and air/foam drilled to conductor TD 230'. SDFN. (SCE)

4/24/04 RIH w/ guide shoe + 5 jts 13 3/8" 54.5# ST&C esg, to 223' GL. RU Halliburton.
cmt'ed csg back to surface w/ 210 sx Class "A" regular cmt. Approx 10 bbls cmt
returns to pit. SWIFN to let cmt set.

4/25/04 RIH w/ 12 ¼" bit. Pre drilled hole to 805'. Drilled rat and mouse hole. RDMOL. (SCE)

5/8/04 Start moving Nabors rig 924 to location.

5/8/04 thru 5/11/04 Contiue moving rig 924 and rigging up same.

5/12/04 Raised Derrick, rig totally on location. Replaced both shale shakers with rebuilt matching
linear shakers. Rebuild choke manifold and replace worn out parts.

Completion

7/20/04 RU SLJ wireline & ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray logs

RU Double Jack tstg & test CSG to 9000 psi, ok. Perf d stg 1 from 11,590 -92,
11,606-

08, 11,634-36, l1,652-55. 3 spots per ft w/33 1/3 power jet guns. 22.7 GM charges, .45

EHP, 38.6 " penetration . Well ready to frac. DC $53946. CWC $1,492,766.(SCE)

7/21/2004 RU Schlumberger PS, Broke down Stage 1 at 5027psi. Pump 250 Bbls of 20# linear gell
and perform step rate test. ISIP 4402psi, 26 holes open. Frac Lower Mesaverde with
17,950# of 20-40 sand and 11,850# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand, using 1631 total
bbls of slickwater (includes 250 bbls of linear gell). ATP 6871psi at 45 BPM Blender had
poor control and pumped a high density sand spike causing well to screen out with
9549psi. Shut down with 70 bbls of sand laden fluid in casing. Flow well back to pit until
sand cleared up. Attempt to GIH to perforate Stage 2. STS grease injector would not
pump grease. RD STS, RU Schlumberger low pressure equipment, GIH and set a 8K
Howco FTFP at 11550'. Perforate Stage 2 Mesaverde 11364'-370', 11476'-481',
11519'-524' 3SPF with a 3 3/8" Power Jet gun. Flow well for 14 total hrs on a 14/64 ck
with 900psi FCP and made 789 BF, BLWTR 842

7/22/04 RU Schlumberger PS. Broke down Stage 2 Mesaverde with 4214psi. Frac Stage 2 with
50,500# of 20-40 sand and 101500# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 1938 bbls of
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Asco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T95, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

Slickwater pad and YF125ST gell. ATP 6514psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4400psi. RU Slb
Wireline equip and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 11300'. Perforate Stage 3 Mesaverde
11158'-162', 11186'-190', 11245'-248', 11284'-286'. Broke down with 5205 psi. Frac
with 38,800# of 20-40 sand and 19,000# of 20-40 SBXL using 2334 bbls of Slickwater.
ATP 7301psi at 59 BPM. ISIP 4580psi. GIH and set a 8K Howco FTFP at 11010'. Had
problems with sand sticking plug, pumped 10 bbls at 1 BPM and freed up plug to set.
Perforate stage 4 Mesaverde 10766'-768', 10816'-821', 10879'-882', 10990'-993'.
Broke down stage 4 with 5948 psi, Frac stage 4 with 21,000# of 20-40 sand and 50,500#
of 20-40 SBXL using 1261 bbls of Clear Frac. ATP 5272psi at 51.8 BPM. ISIP 4165psi.
Flow well for 9 hrs on a 16/64 ck.with 1050psi FCP and made 879 BF. TR 1668,
BLWTR 5496.

7/23/2004 RU Schlumberger Wireline and STS 10K lubricator. GIH and perforate Mesaverde
10350'-355' 3 SPF. Did not frac this interval.GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 9430'.
Perforate Stage 5 Dark Canyon 9308'-314', 9406'-412' 3 SPF. Frac stage 5 with
19,000# of sand and 51,800# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2576 bbls of Slickwater. ATP
6059psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 3600psi. RU wireline and attempt to run a Howco 8K FTFP,
plug came apart and stuck in frac head. Disassemble and remove pieces of plug. GIH and
set a Howco 8K FTFP at 6926'. Perforate Stage 6 Wasatch 6782'-787', 6898'-900',
6907'-910'. RU Slb PS. Broke down Wasatch with 5156psi. Frac with 54,350# of 20-40
sand and 40,950# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 2788 bbls of Slickwater. ATP
4719psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 1562. Very erratic Pressure plot. Flowed well on a 14 then 16
then 20/64ck with 100psi final FCP and made 787 BF, TR 2255BF, BLWTR 10073 BF.
DC $ 537,176 CC $2,029,942

7/24/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 700 FCP on 20/64" ck. Flowed 787 bbls in 10 hrs. TR 2455.
BLWTR 10073. DC $16,918. CWC $2,046,860. (SCE)

Run tbg, Drill out FTFP's

7/25/04 7:00 AM, Well barely flowing @0 psi on open ck. Flowed 575 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 3030.
BLWTR 9498. MIRU Pool rig 820 (Alex and Everitt). Water barely flowing over top of
valve. NU Weatherford BOP's. RIH w/ Varel 3 ¾" L-2 bit + Weatherford pump off bit
sub + XN nipple + 2 3/8" N-80/P110 tbg (f/ Aztec Pipe). SD w/ bit @+-6700. Left
well open to tk on small ck for night. DC $6220 CWC $2,053,080.(SCE)

7/26/04 Fin RIH to first FTFP @6926'. Tag sand at 6785', cire down to plug at 6913' and drill
same. Well came in flowing hard. Continue to RIH and drilled Plug #2 @9420, (no
sand), RIH and drill Plug #3 at 11,000', RIH and drill Plug #4 at 11,300', RIH to 11,500'
SDFN. Flowed well 24 hrs on a 20/64 ck with 2050psi FCP and made 1810 BF, TR
4940, BLWTR 7588. DC $6675 CC $2,059,755

7/27/04 Flowed well 24 hrs on a 24/64 ck with 1150psi FCP and made 1193BF, TR 6133 BF,
BLWTR 6395 BF. DC $39047 CC $2,098,802

7/28/04 Drilled Plug #5 at 11550'. RIH and tag at 11640, clean out to PBTD at 11731' POOH
and lay down 163 jts tbg. Landed tubing at 6669'. ND BOP's and NU Tree. Broach
tubing, drop ball and pump off bit and bit sub with 22 BW. RD rig ready to move to
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Slickwater pad and YF125ST gell. ATP 6514psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4400psi. RU Slb
Wireline equip and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 11300'. Perforate Stage 3 Mesaverde
11158'-162', 11186'-190', 11245'-248', 11284'-286'. Broke down with 5205 psi. Frac
with 38,800# of 20-40 sand and 19,000# of 20-40 SBXL using 2334 bbls of Slickwater.
ATP 7301psi at 59 BPM. ISIP 4580psi. GIH and set a 8K Howco FTFP at 11010'. Had
problems with sand sticking plug, pumped 10 bbls at 1 BPM and freed up plug to set.
Perforate stage 4 Mesaverde 10766'-768', 10816'-821', 10879'-882', 10990'-993'.
Broke down stage 4 with 5948 psi, Frac stage 4 with 21,000# of 20-40 sand and 50,500#
of 20-40 SBXL using 1261 bbls of Clear Frac. ATP 5272psi at 51.8 BPM. ISIP 4165psi.
Flow well for 9 hrs on a 16/64 ck.with 1050psi FCP and made 879 BF. TR 1668,
BLWTR 5496.

7/23/2004 RU Schlumberger Wireline and STS 10K lubricator. GIH and perforate Mesaverde
10350'-355' 3 SPF. Did not frac this interval.GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 9430'.
Perforate Stage 5 Dark Canyon 9308'-314', 9406'-412' 3 SPF. Frac stage 5 with
19,000# of sand and 51,800# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2576 bbls of Slickwater. ATP
6059psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 3600psi. RU wireline and attempt to run a Howco 8K FTFP,
plug came apart and stuck in frac head. Disassemble and remove pieces of plug. GIH and
set a Howco 8K FTFP at 6926'. Perforate Stage 6 Wasatch 6782'-787', 6898'-900',
6907'-910'. RU Slb PS. Broke down Wasatch with 5156psi. Frac with 54,350# of 20-40
sand and 40,950# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 2788 bbls of Slickwater. ATP
4719psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 1562. Very erratic Pressure plot. Flowed well on a 14 then 16
then 20/64ck with 100psi final FCP and made 787 BF, TR 2255BF, BLWTR 10073 BF.
DC $ 537,176 CC $2,029,942

7/24/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 700 FCP on 20/64" ck. Flowed 787 bbls in 10 hrs. TR 2455.
BLWTR 10073. DC $16,918. CWC $2,046,860. (SCE)

Run tbg, Drill out FTFP's

7/25/04 7:00 AM, Well barely flowing @0 psi on open ck. Flowed 575 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 3030.
BLWTR 9498. MIRU Pool rig 820 (Alex and Everitt). Water barely flowing over top of
valve. NU Weatherford BOP's. RIH w/ Varel 3 ¾" L-2 bit + Weatherford pump off bit
sub + XN nipple + 2 3/8" N-80/P110 tbg (f/ Aztec Pipe). SD w/ bit @+-6700. Left
well open to tk on small ck for night. DC $6220 CWC $2,053,080.(SCE)

7/26/04 Fin RIH to first FTFP @6926'. Tag sand at 6785', cire down to plug at 6913' and drill
same. Well came in flowing hard. Continue to RIH and drilled Plug #2 @9420, (no
sand), RIH and drill Plug #3 at 11,000', RIH and drill Plug #4 at 11,300', RIH to 11,500'
SDFN. Flowed well 24 hrs on a 20/64 ck with 2050psi FCP and made 1810 BF, TR
4940, BLWTR 7588. DC $6675 CC $2,059,755

7/27/04 Flowed well 24 hrs on a 24/64 ck with 1150psi FCP and made 1193BF, TR 6133 BF,
BLWTR 6395 BF. DC $39047 CC $2,098,802

7/28/04 Drilled Plug #5 at 11550'. RIH and tag at 11640, clean out to PBTD at 11731' POOH
and lay down 163 jts tbg. Landed tubing at 6669'. ND BOP's and NU Tree. Broach
tubing, drop ball and pump off bit and bit sub with 22 BW. RD rig ready to move to
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Wilkin Ridge. Flowed well 24 hrs on a 24 then 20/64 ck with 900psi FTP and 1725psi CP
and made 720 BF. TR 6853, BLWTR 5747. DC
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Federal 11-21-9-19 - Completion

7/20/04 RU SLB Wireline (Dwayne) and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray log. RU
Double Jack testing and psi tested csg to 9000 psi, ok. Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11590' - 92,
11606 - 08, 11634 - 36, 11652 - 55, 3 SPF w/ 3 3/8" Powerjet guns, .45 EHD, 38.6"
pen, 22.7 gm chgs. Well ready to frac. DC 53946. CWC 1,492,766. (SCE)

7/21/2004 RU Schlumberger PS, Broke down Stage 1 at 5027psi. Pump 250 Bbls of 20# linear gell
and perform step rate test. ISIP 4402psi, 26 holes open. Frac Lower Mesaverde with
17,950# of 20-40 sand and 11,850# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand, using 1631 total
bbls of slickwater (includes 250 bbls of linear gell). ATP 6871psi at 45 BPM Blender had
poor control and pumped a high density sand spike causing well to screen out with
9549psi. Shut down with 70 bbls of sand laden fluid in casing. Flow well back to pit until
sand cleared up. Attempt to GIH to perforate Stage 2. STS grease injector would not
pump grease. RD STS, RU Schlumberger low pressure equipment, GIH and set a 8K
Howco FTFP at 11550'. Perforate Stage 2 Mesaverde 11364'-370', 11476'-481',
11519'-524' 3SPF with a 3 3/8" Power Jet gun. Flow well for 14 total hrs on a 14/64 ck
with 900psi FCP and made 789 BF, BLWTR 842

7/22/04 RU Schlumberger PS. Broke down Stage 2 Mesaverde with 4214psi. Frac Stage 2 with
50,500# of 20-40 sand and 101500# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 1938 bbls of
Slickwater pad and YFl25ST gell. ATP 6514psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4400psi. RU Slb
Wireline equip and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 11300'. Perforate Stage 3 Mesaverde
11158'-162', 11186'-190', 11245'-248', 11284'-286'. Broke down with 5205 psi. Frac
with 38,800# of 20-40 sand and 19,000# of 20-40 SBXL using 2334 bbls of Slickwater.
ATP 7301psi at 59 BPM. ISIP 4580psi. GIH and set a 8K Howco FTFP at 11010'. Had
problems with sand sticking plug, pumped 10 bbls at 1 BPM and freed up plug to set.
Perforate stage 4 Mesaverde 10766'-768', 10816'-821', 10879'-882', 10990'-993'.
Broke down stage 4 with 5948 psi, Frac stage 4 with 21,000# of 20-40 sand and 50,500#
of20-40 SBXL using 1261 bbls of Clear Frac. ATP 5272psi at 51.8 BPM. ISIP 4165psi.
Flow well for 9 hrs on a 16/64 ck.with 1050psi FCP and made 879 BF. TR 1668,
BLWTR 5496.

7/23/2004 RU Schlumberger Wireline and STS 10K lubricator. GIH and perforate Mesaverde
10350'-355' 3 SPF. Did not frac this interval.GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 9430'.
Perforate Stage 5 Dark Canyon 9308'-314', 9406'-412' 3 SPF. Frac stage 5 with
19,000# of sand and 51,800# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2576 bbls of Slickwater. ATP
6059psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 3600psi. RU wireline and attempt to run a Howco 8K FTFP,
plug came apart and stuck in frac head. Disassemble and remove pieces of plug. GIH and
set a Howco 8K FTFP at 6926'. Perforate Stage 6 Wasatch 6782'-787', 6898'-900',
6907'-910'. RU Slb PS. Broke down Wasatch with 5156psi. Frac with 54,350# of 20-40
sand and 40,950# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 2788 bbls of Slickwater. ATP
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4719psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 1562. Very erratic Pressure plot. Flowed well on a 14 then 16
then 20/64ck with 100psi final FCP and made 787 BF, TR 2255BF, BLWTR 10073 BF.
DC $ 537,176 CC $2,029,942

7/24/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 700 FCP on 20/64" ck. Flowed 787 bbls in 10 hrs. TR 2455.
BLWTR 10073. DC $16,918. CWC $2,046,860.(SCE)

Run tbg, Drill out FTFP's

7/25/04 7:00 AM, Well barely flowing @0 psi on open ck. Flowed 575 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 3030.
BLWTR 9498. MIRU Pool rig 820 (Alex and Everitt). Water barely flowing over top of
valve. NU Weatherford BOP's. RIH w/ Varel 3 ¾" L-2 bit + Weatherford pump off bit
sub + XN nipple + 2 3/8" N-80/P110 tbg (f/ Aztec Pipe). SD w/ bit @+-6700. Left
well open to tk on small ek for night. DC $6220. CWC $2,053,080. (SCE)

7/26/04 Fin RIH and tagged sd @6785'. RU Pool power swivel and circ cln to first FTFP @
6926'. Drill up plug and well kicked off flowing back again. Maintained 1500 psi FCP
w/ 40/64" to ¾" ck to pit. Continued to drill up FTFP's @9420', 11000', 11300',
pumping wtr @1 bpm. RIH to last plug @11550'. Turned over to Premier to flow
back. DC $39,047. CWC $2,092,127.

7/27/04 Rig SD today to FB well. Well flowing back @2550 FCP, on 20/64" ck. Made 1810
bb1sin 12 hrs. TR 4940. BLWTR 7588. DC $6852. CWC $2,098,979.

7/28/04 Well flowing back @l150 FCP, on 24/64" ck. Made 1193 bbls in 12 hrs. TR 6113.
BLWTR 6395. RIH to plug @11550' and drill up. Cont RIH and tag fill @11640'.
Cln out to PBTD @11731' (76' rat hole). PPOH and LD 163 jts. Landed tbg @6669'
w/ 206 jts. ND BOPE. NU tree. Broached tbg to SN. Dropped ball and loaded tbg w/
22 bbls. Pumped off bit and sub. Fld esg for 2 more hrs and cleaned up. RD and ready
to move. DC $28,647(inc build battery). CWC $2,127,626.

7/29/04 Well flowed back 720 bbls in 12 hrs, on 20/64" ck. TR 6845. BLWTR 5747. DC
$2000. CWC $2,129,626.

7/30/04 Well flowed back 497 bbls in 24 hrs, on 24/64" ck. TR 7350. BLWTR 5250. Turned
well dn line, thru separator and sold gas while continuing to cln up FB. DC $2000.
CWC $2,131,626.

8/2/04 SWI for psi build up. (SCE)

8/3/04 SI

8/4/04 Opened well up to sep for flow test. SITP 2700. SICP 2750.

8/5/04 Well flowing this AM w/ 500 FTP and 1150 CP. Made 1.517 MMCF in last 24 hrs. 396
BW and 17 BO on various eks. DC $2000. CWC $2,133,626.(SCE)
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Cln out to PBTD @11731' (76' rat hole). PPOH and LD 163 jts. Landed tbg @6669'
w/ 206 jts. ND BOPE. NU tree. Broached tbg to SN. Dropped ball and loaded tbg w/
22 bbls. Pumped off bit and sub. Fld esg for 2 more hrs and cleaned up. RD and ready
to move. DC $28,647(inc build battery). CWC $2,127,626.
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Federal 11-21-9-19 - Completion

7/20/04 RU SLB Wireline (Dwayne) and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray log. RU
Double Jack testing and psi tested esg to 9000 psi, ok. Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11590' - 92,
l1606 -08, 11634 - 36, 11652 - 55, 3 SPF w/ 3 3/8" Powerjet guns, .45 EHD, 38.6"
pen, 22.7 gm chgs. Well ready to frac. DC 53946. CWC 1,492,766. (SCE)

7/21/2004 RU Schlumberger PS, Broke down Stage 1 at 5027psi. Pump 250 Bbls of 20# linear gell
and perform step rate test. ISIP 4402psi, 26 holes open. Frac Lower Mesaverde with
17,950# of 20-40 sand and 11,850# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand, using 1631 total
bbls of slickwater (includes 250 bbls of linear gell). ATP 6871psi at 45 BPM Blender had
poor control and pumped a high density sand spike causing well to screen out with
9549psi. Shut down with 70 bbls of sand laden fluid in casing. Flow well back to pit until
sand cleared up. Attempt to GIH to perforate Stage 2. STS grease injector would not
pump grease. RD STS, RU Schlumberger low pressure equipment, GIH and set a 8K
Howco FTFP at 11550'. Perforate Stage 2 Mesaverde 11364'-370', 11476'-481',
11519'-524' 3SPF with a 3 3/8" Power Jet gun. Flow well for 14 total hrs on a 14/64 ck
with 900psi FCP and made 789 BF, BLWTR 842

7/22/04 RU Schlumberger PS. Broke down Stage 2 Mesaverde with 4214psi. Frac Stage 2 with
50,500# of 20-40 sand and 101500# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 1938 bbls of
Slickwater pad and YF125ST gell. ATP 6514psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4400psi. RU Slb
Wireline equip and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 11300'. Perforate Stage 3 Mesaverde
11158'-162', 11186'-190', 11245'-248', 11284'-286'. Broke down with 5205 psi. Frac
with 38,800# of 20-40 sand and 19,000# of 20-40 SBXL using 2334 bbls of Slickwater.
ATP 7301psi at 59 BPM. ISIP 4580psi. GIH and set a 8K Howco FTFP at 11010'. Had
problems with sand sticking plug, pumped 10 bbls at 1 BPM and freed up plug to set.
Perforate stage 4 Mesaverde 10766'-768', 10816'-821', 10879'-882', 10990'-993'.
Broke down stage 4 with 5948 psi, Frac stage 4 with 21,000# of 20-40 sand and 50,500#
of 20-40 SBXL using 1261 bbls of Clear Frac. ATP 5272psi at 51.8 BPM. ISIP 4165psi.
Flow well for 9 hrs on a 16/64 ck.with 1050psi FCP and made 879 BF. TR 1668,
BLWTR 5496.

7/23/2004 RU Schlumberger Wireline and STS 10K lubricator. GIH and perforate Mesaverde
10350'-355' 3 SPF. Did not frac this interval.GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 9430'.
Perforate Stage 5 Dark Canyon 9308'-314', 9406'-412' 3 SPF. Frac stage 5 with
19,000# of sand and 51,800# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2576 bbls of Slickwater. ATP
6059psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 3600psi. RU wireline and attempt to run a Howco 8K FTFP,
plug came apart and stuck in frac head. Disassemble and remove pieces of plug. GIH and
set a Howco 8K FTFP at 6926'. Perforate Stage 6 Wasatch 6782'-787', 6898'-900',
6907'-910'. RU Slb PS. Broke down Wasatch with 5156psi. Frac with 54,350# of 20-40
sand and 40,950# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 2788 bbls of Slickwater. ATP
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4719psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 1562. Very erratic Pressure plot. Flowed well on a 14 then 16
then 20/64ck with 100psi final FCP and made 787 BF, TR 2255BF, BLWTR 10073 BF.
DC $ 537,176 CC $2,029,942

7/24/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 700 FCP on 20/64" ck. Flowed 787 bbls in 10 hrs. TR 2455.
BLWTR 10073. DC $16,918. CWC $2,046,860.(SCE)

Run tbg, Drill out FTFP's

7/25/04 7:00 AM, Well barely flowing @0 psi on open ck. Flowed 575 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 3030.
BLWTR 9498. MIRU Pool rig 820 (Alex and Everitt). Water barely flowing over top of
valve. NU Weatherford BOP's. RIH w/ Varel 3 ¾" L-2 bit + Weatherford pump off bit
sub + XN nipple + 2 3/8" N-80/P110 tbg (f/ Aztec Pipe). SD w/ bit @+-6700. Left
well open to tk on small ck for night. DC $6220. CWC $2,053,080.(SCE)

7/26/04 Fin RIH and tagged sd @6785'. RU Pool power swivel and circ cln to first FTFP @
6926'. Drill up plug and well kicked off flowing back again. Maintained 1500 psi FCP
w/ 40/64" to ¾" ck to pit. Continued to drill up FTFP's @9420', l1000', 11300',
pumping wtr @ l bpm. RIH to last plug @ l1550'. Turned over to Premier to flow
back. DC $39,047. CWC $2,092,127.

7/27/04 Rig SD today to FB well. Well flowing back @2550 FCP, on 20/64" ck. Made 1810
bbls in 12 hrs. TR 4940. BLWTR 7588. DC $6852. CWC $2,098,979.

7/28/04 Well flowing back @ l150 FCP, on 24/64" ck. Made 1193 bbls in 12 hrs. TR 6113.
BLWTR 6395. RIH to plug @11550' and drill up. Cont RIH and tag fill @11640'.
Cln out to PBTD @11731' (76' rat hole). PPOH and LD 163 jts. Landed tbg @6669'
w/ 206 jts. ND BOPE. NU tree. Broached tbg to SN. Dropped ball and loaded tbg w/
22 bbls. Pumped off bit and sub. Fld csg for 2 more hrs and cleaned up. RD and ready
to move. DC $28,647(inc build battery). CWC $2,127,626.

7/29/04 Well flowed back 720 bbls in 12 hrs, on 20/64" ck. TR 6845. BLWTR 5747. DC
$2000. CWC $2,129,626.

7/30/04 Well flowed back 497 bbls in 24 hrs, on 24/64" ck. TR 7350. BLWTR 5250. Turned
well dn line, thru separator and sold gas while continuing to cln up FB. DC $2000.
CWC $2,131,626.

8/2/04 SWI for psi build up. (SCE)

8/3/04 SI

8/4/04 Opened well up to sep for flow test. SITP 2700. SICP 2750.

8/5/04 Well flowing this AM w/ 500 FTP and 1150 CP. Made 1.517 MMCF in last 24 hrs. 396
BW and 17 BO on various eks. DC $2000. CWC $2,133,626.(SCE)
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NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

8/15/04 Late costs: build battery, wtr trucking, Frac tk rental, move tks. DC 31,919. CWC
2,165,545.

Federal 11-21-9-19

Run Production Log

10/17/04 RU Schlumberger Slick line unit (Scott Pitt-Evanston). Ran Memory Production Log (on
slickline). (SCE)
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NE/NW Sec. 21, T95, R19E

Uintah County, Utah "i gg0 55 DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

4/7/04 Huffman Enterprises building rd into loc. (SCE)

4/12/04 Rd work 90% finished. MI D-8 cat to build loc. (SCE)

4/15/04 Loc finished and still working on reserve pit. Haven't had to blast to build loc. (SCE)

4/20/04 Finishing loc and pit today. Had to blast bottom of pit to get deep enough. (SCE)

4/23/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout rathole rig. Spudded well 9:00 AM 4/22/04. Ran 17 ¼'
hammer bit and air/foam drilled to conductor TD 230'. SDFN. (SCE)

4/24/04 RIH w/ guide shoe + 5 jts 13 3/8" 54.5# ST& C csg, to 223' GL. RU Halliburton.
cmt'ed esg back to surface w/ 210 sx Class "A" regular omt. Approx 10 bbls cmt
returns to pit. SWIFN to let cmt set.

4/25/04 RIH w/ 12 ¼" bit. Pre drilled hole to 805'. Drilled rat and mouse hole. RDMOL. (SCE)

5/8/04 Start moving Nabors rig 924 to location.

5/8/04 thru 5/11/04 Contiue moving rig 924 and rigging up same.

5/12/04 Raised Derrick, rig totally on location. Replaced both shale shakers with rebuilt matching
linear shakers. Rebuild choke manifold and replace worn out parts.

Federal 11-21-9-19 - Completion

7/20/04 RU SLB Wireline (Dwayne) and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray log. RU
Double Jack testing and psi tested csg to 9000 psi, ok. Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11590' - 92,
11606 - 08, 11634 - 36, 11652 - 55, 3 SPF w/ 3 3/8" Powerjet guns, .45 EHD, 38.6"
pen, 22.7 gm chgs. Well ready to frac. DC 53946. CWC 1,492,766. (SCE)

7/21/2004 RU Schlumberger PS, Broke down Stage 1 at 5027psi. Pump 250 Bbls of 20# linear gell
and perform step rate test. ISIP 4402psi, 26 holes open. Frac Lower Mesaverde with
17,950# of 20-40 sand and 11,850# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand, using 1631 total
bbls of slickwater (includes 250 bbls of linear gell). ATP 6871psi at 45 BPM Blender had
poor control and pumped a high density sand spike causing well to screen out with
9549psi. Shut down with 70 bbls of sand laden fluid in casing. Flow well back to pit until
sand cleared up. Attempt to GIH to perforate Stage 2. STS grease injector would not
pump grease. RD STS, RU Schlumberger low pressure equipment, GIH and set a 8K
Howco FTFP at 11550'. Perforate Stage 2 Mesaverde 11364'-370', 11476'-481',
11519'-524' 3SPF with a 3 3/8" Power Jet gun. Flow well for 14 total hrs on a 14/64 ck
with 900psi FCP and made 789 BF, BLWTR 842

7/22/04 RU Schlumberger PS. Broke down Stage 2 Mesaverde with 4214psi. Frac Stage 2 with
50,500# of 20-40 sand and 101500# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 1938 bbls of
Slickwater pad and YFl25ST gell. ATP 6514psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4400psi. RU Slb
Wireline equip and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 11300'. Perforate Stage 3 Mesaverde
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o ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
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11158'-162', 11186'-190', 11245'-248', 11284'-286'. Broke down with 5205 psi. Frac
with 38,800# of 20-40 sand and 19,000# of 20-40 SBXL using 2334 bbls of Slickwater.
ATP 7301psi at 59 BPM. ISIP 4580psi. GIH and set a 8K Howco FTFP at 11010'. Had
problems with sand sticking plug, pumped 10 bbls at 1 BPM and freed up plug to set.
Perforate stage 4 Mesaverde 10766'-768', 10816'-821', 10879'-882', 10990'-993'.
Broke down stage 4 with 5948 psi, Frac stage 4 with 21,000# of 20-40 sand and 50,500#
of 20-40 SBXL using 1261 bbls of Clear Frac. ATP 5272psi at 51.8 BPM. ISIP 4165psi.
Flow well for 9 hrs on a 16/64 ck.with 1050psi FCP and made 879 BF. TR 1668,
BLWTR 5496.

7/23/2004 RU Schlumberger Wireline and STS 10K lubricator. GIH and perforate Mesaverde
10350'-355' 3 SPF. Did not frac this interval.GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 9430'.
Perforate Stage 5 Dark Canyon 9308'-314', 9406'-412' 3 SPF. Frac stage 5 with
19,000# of sand and 51,800# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2576 bbls of Slickwater. ATP
6059psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 3600psi. RU wireline and attempt to run a Howco 8K FTFP,
plug came apart and stuck in frac head. Disassemble and remove pieces of plug. GIH and
set a Howco 8K FTFP at 6926'. Perforate Stage 6 Wasatch 6782'-787', 6898'-900',
6907'-910'. RU Slb PS. Broke down Wasatch with 5156psi. Frac with 54,350# of 20-40
sand and 40,950# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 2788 bbls of Slickwater. ATP
4719psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 1562. Very erratic Pressure plot. Flowed well on a 14 then 16
then 20/64ck with 100psi final FCP and made 787 BF, TR 2255BF, BLWTR 10073 BF.
DC $ 537,176 CC $2,029,942

7/24/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 700 FCP on 20/64" ck. Flowed 787 bbls in 10 hrs. TR 2455.
BLWTR 10073. DC $16,918. CWC $2,046,860.(SCE)

Run tbg, Drill out FTFP's

7/25/04 7:00 AM, Well barely flowing @0 psi on open ek. Flowed 575 bbls in 24 hrs. TR 3030.
BLWTR 9498. MIRU Pool rig 820 (Alex and Everitt). Water barely flowing over top of
valve. NU Weatherford BOP's. RIH w/ Varel 3 ¾" L-2 bit + Weatherford pump off bit
sub + XN nipple + 2 3/8" N-80/Pl10 tbg (f/ Aztec Pipe). SD w/ bit @+-6700. Left
well open to tk on small ck for night. DC $6220. CWC $2,053,080. (SCE)

7/26/04 Fin RIH and tagged sd @6785'. RU Pool power swivel and circ cln to first FTFP @
6926'. Drill up plug and well kicked off flowing back again. Maintained 1500 psi FCP
w/ 40/64" to ¾" ck to pit. Continued to drill up FTFP's @9420', 11000', l1300',
pumping wtr @l bpm. RIH to last plug @l 1550'. Turned over to Premier to flow
back. DC $39,047. CWC $2,092,127.

7/27/04 Rig SD today to FB well. Well flowing back @2550 FCP, on 20/64" ck. Made 1810
bbls in 12 hrs. TR 4940. BLWTR 7588. DC $6852. CWC $2,098,979.

7/28/04 Well flowing back @l150 FCP, on 24/64" ck. Made 1193 bbls in 12 hrs. TR 6113.
BLWTR 6395. RIH to plug @11550' and drill up. Cont RIH and tag fill @11640'.
Cln out to PBTD @11731' (76' rat hole). PPOH and LD 163 jts. Landed tbg @6669'
w/ 206 jts. ND BOPE. NU tree. Broached tbg to SN. Dropped ball and loaded tbg w/
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22 bbls. Pumped off bit and sub. Fld csg for 2 more hrs and cleaned up. RD and ready
to move. DC $28,647(ine build battery). CWC $2,127,626.

7/29/04 Well flowed back 720 bbls in 12 hrs, on 20/64" ck. TR 6845. BLWTR 5747. DC
$2000. CWC $2,129,626.

7/30/04 Well flowed back 497 bbls in 24 hrs, on 24/64" ck. TR 7350. BLWTR 5250. Turned
well dn line, thru separator and sold gas while continuing to cln up FB. DC $2000.
CWC $2,131,626.

8/2/04 SWI for psi build up. (SCE)

8/3/04 SI

8/4/04 Opened well up to sep for flow test. SITP 2700. SICP 2750.

8/5/04 Well flowing this AM w/ 500 FTP and 1150 CP. Made 1.517 MMCF in last 24 hrs. 396
BW and 17 BO on various eks. DC $2000. CWC $2,133,626.(SCE)

8/15/04 Late costs: build battery, wtr trucking, Frac tk rental, move tks. DC 31,919. CWC
2,165,545.

Federal 11-21-9-19

Run Production Los

10/17/04 RU Schlumberger Slick line unit (Scott Pitt-Evanston). Ran Memory Production Log (on
slickline). (SCE)

11/13/04 MIRU Temples Well serv. Opened csg to sales and blew well dn. Pumped 30 bbls
produced water dn tbg to quick kill. ND tree. NU BOPE. PU and RIH w/ 52 jts 2 3/8"
N-80 tbg. Well kicked off flowing. Put dn line for night. (KF w/ Premier) DC 6305
CC 6305

11/14/04 Killed tbg and fin RIH. Tag fill @ l1746'. LD 4 jts and landed tbg @ l1622 w/ 367 jts.
DN BOPE. NU tree. Tried to unload tbg to tk. No success. SWIFN. Turned well over
to pumpers. RDMOL. (KF w/ Premier) DC 4980. CC 11285
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11/14/04 Killed tbg and fin RIH. Tag fill @ l1746'. LD 4 jts and landed tbg @ l1622 w/ 367 jts.
DN BOPE. NU tree. Tried to unload tbg to tk. No success. SWIFN. Turned well over
to pumpers. RDMOL. (KF w/ Premier) DC 4980. CC 11285

\UULUIVit~1\UDIVIUbtK\LUCALN~1\1empetutKA~LUUL

Page 3



GASC0A' *

EnergyV

July 6, 2005

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re: Federal Completion Forms
Federal 44-20-9-19
Federal 24-20-9-19
Federal 11-21-9-19
Federal 11-22-9-19
Federal 22-20-10-18
Federal 21-6-10-19
Uintah County, UT

Ladies and Gentlemen::

Enclosed per your request are originally signed Federal Completion Forms for the
captioned wells. Be advised that completion forms for the State 24-16-9-19, Federal 41-
31-9-19 and the Federal 31-21-9-19 wells will be provided under separate cover.

Sincerely,

Gasco Production Company

Mari A. Johnson
Manager of Property Administration
Direct Telephone: 303-996-1815

Encl· RECEIVED
Cc: Tony Sharp, Gasco Production Al- I i US

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
GASCOEnergy, Inc.
8 inverness Drive East, Suite 100 Tel: (303) 483-0044 Email: invest@gascoenergy.com
Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: (303) 483-0011 Website:www.gascoenergy.com AMEX:

GASC0A' *

EnergyV

July 6, 2005

Utah Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Re: Federal Completion Forms
Federal 44-20-9-19
Federal 24-20-9-19
Federal 11-21-9-19
Federal 11-22-9-19
Federal 22-20-10-18
Federal 21-6-10-19
Uintah County, UT

Ladies and Gentlemen::

Enclosed per your request are originally signed Federal Completion Forms for the
captioned wells. Be advised that completion forms for the State 24-16-9-19, Federal 41-
31-9-19 and the Federal 31-21-9-19 wells will be provided under separate cover.

Sincerely,

Gasco Production Company

Mari A. Johnson
Manager of Property Administration
Direct Telephone: 303-996-1815

Encl· RECEIVED
Cc: Tony Sharp, Gasco Production Al- I i US

DIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING
GASCOEnergy, Inc.
8 inverness Drive East, Suite 100 Tel: (303) 483-0044 Email: invest@gascoenergy.com
Englewood, CO 80112-5625 Fax: (303) 483-0011 Website:www.gascoenergy.com AMEX:



Forn.3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(AuguË1999) DEP ENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNO. 1004-0137

BU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. Lease SerialNo.

UTU-78433

la. Type of Well Oil Gas Dry Other 6. If Indian,Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: New Work Over Deepen Plug Back Diff. Resvr. NA

Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and

NA
2. Name of Operator 8. Lease Name and Well No.
Gasco Production Company Federal 11-21-9-19
3. Address 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. API Well No.
14 Inverness Drive East, Ste. H-236, Englewood, CO 80112 303-483-0044 43-047-34608
4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)*

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surface 57T FNL & 522' FWL (NWNW) Sec. 21-T9S-R19E, SLM Riverbend

11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and

At top prod. interval reported below SAME Survey or Are21-T9S-Ri9E
12. County or Parish 13. State

At total depth SAME Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16 te Completed 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

D & A Í X Í Ready to Prod05/13/04 06/18/04 4775' KBI 4761' GL07/24/04
18. Total Depth: MD 11800 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 20. Depth Iridge Plug Set MD

TVD 11800 TVD TVD

21. Type Electric & Other echanical Logs Run (Submit co of each) c 22. Was well cored? No es(Submit analysis)
e

. /6Ñ&'Ä Was DST run? No es (Submit copy)
- FDC/CNLIGR/SP:<RICCL/CBLIVDL Directional Survey? No es (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & SlurryVol. CementTop* AmountPulled
Depth Type of Cement (BBL)

17-1/2" 13-3/8" H40 54.4# surface 223 223 210 Class "A" surface
12-1/4" 8-5/8" M-50 28# surface 3514 3514 540 HiLift + 230 "G" 443 surface
7-7/8" 4-1/2" P110 13.5# surface 11800 11800 305 HiLift + 2563 50/50 Por "G" 749 surface

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size )epth Set (MD 'acker Set (MD

2 3/8" 6669'

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
Lower Mesaverde 11590 11655 11590-92, 11606-08, 11634-36, 11652-5: 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 27 producing

Mesaverde 11364 11524 11364-370, 11476-481, 11519-524 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 48 producing

C3 Mesaverde 11158 11286 11158-62, 11186-90, 11245-48, 11284-8: 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 39 producing
D) Mesaverde 10766 10993 10766-68, 10816-21, 10879-82, 10990-9: 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 39 producing

F) Mesaverde 10350 10355 10350-355 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 15 producing

F1 Dark Canyon 9308 9412 9308-314, 9406-412 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 36 producing

G) Wasatch 6782 6910 6782-787, 6898-900, 6907-910 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 30 producing

H3
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Stueeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
11590-11655 17,950# 20-40 sand & 11,850#of 20-40 SBXL sand, 1631 bbis Slickwater (this incl 250 bbis linear gel).
11364-11524 50,500# 20-40 sand & 101,500# 20-40 SBXL sand, 1938 bbis & YF125ST gel
11158-11286 38,800#20-40 sand & 19,000#20-40 SBXL sand, 2334 bbis Slickwater
10766-10993 21,000#20-40 sand & 50,500#20-40 SBXL sand, 1261 bbis Clear Frac
10350-10355 No Frac

9308-9412 19,000#20-40 sand & 51,800#20-40 SBXL sand, 2576 bbis Slickwater
6782-6910 54,350# 20-40 sand & 40,950# 20-40 SBXL sand, 2788 bbis Slickwater

28. Production - Interval A-G Commingled Lower Mesaverde, Mesaverde, Dark Canyon and Wasatch

Date First Test Date Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method

Produced Tested Producti BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

07/24/04 08/05/04 24 17 1,517 396 55 Flowing
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg.

Size Flwg Press.

18/64" si 500 1150 + 17 1517 396 55 Producing
28

Date First Test Date Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Tested Producti BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press.

Size Flwg

> RECEIVED
(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)

Forn.3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(AuguË1999) DEP ENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNO. 1004-0137

BU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELLCOMPLETIONORRECOMPLETIONREPORTANDLOG 5. Lease SerialNo.

UTU-78433

la. Type of Well Oil Gas Dry Other 6. If Indian,Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion: New Work Over Deepen Plug Back Diff. Resvr. NA

Other 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and

NA
2. Name of Operator 8. Lease Name and Well No.
Gasco Production Company Federal 11-21-9-19
3. Address 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. API Well No.
14 Inverness Drive East, Ste. H-236, Englewood, CO 80112 303-483-0044 43-047-34608
4. Location of Well (Report locations clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)*

10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
At surface 57T FNL & 522' FWL (NWNW) Sec. 21-T9S-R19E, SLM Riverbend

11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and

At top prod. interval reported below SAME Survey or Are21-T9S-Ri9E
12. County or Parish 13. State

At total depth SAME Uintah Utah
14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16 te Completed 17. Elevations (DF, RKB, RT, GL)*

D & A Í X Í Ready to Prod
05/13/04 06/18/04 4775' KBI 4761' GL07/24/04

18. Total Depth: MD 11800 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 20. Depth Iridge Plug Set MD

TVD 11800 TVD TVD

21. Type Electric & Other echanical Logs Run (Submit co of each) c 22. Was well cored? No es(Submit analysis)
e

. /6Ñ&'Ä Was DST run? No es (Submit copy)
- FDC/CNLIGR/SP:<RICCL/CBLIVDL Directional Survey? No es (Submit copy)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Top (MD) Bottom (MD) Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & SlurryVol. CementTop* AmountPulled
Depth Type of Cement (BBL)

17-1/2" 13-3/8" H40 54.4# surface 223 223 210 Class "A" surface
12-1/4" 8-5/8" M-50 28# surface 3514 3514 540 HiLift + 230 "G" 443 surface
7-7/8" 4-1/2" P110 13.5# surface 11800 11800 305 HiLift + 2563 50/50 Por "G" 749 surface

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size )epth Set (MD 'acker Set (MD

2 3/8" 6669'

25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status
Lower Mesaverde 11590 11655 11590-92, 11606-08, 11634-36, 11652-5: 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 27 producing

Mesaverde 11364 11524 11364-370, 11476-481, 11519-524 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 48 producing

C3 Mesaverde 11158 11286 11158-62, 11186-90, 11245-48, 11284-8: 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 39 producing

D) Mesaverde 10766 10993 10766-68, 10816-21, 10879-82, 10990-9: 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 39 producing

F) Mesaverde 10350 10355 10350-355 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 15 producing

F1 Dark Canyon 9308 9412 9308-314, 9406-412 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 36 producing

G) Wasatch 6782 6910 6782-787, 6898-900, 6907-910 3-3/8" gun, .45" EHD 30 producing

H3
27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Stueeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and type of Material
11590-11655 17,950# 20-40 sand & 11,850#of 20-40 SBXL sand, 1631 bbis Slickwater (this incl 250 bbis linear gel).
11364-11524 50,500# 20-40 sand & 101,500# 20-40 SBXL sand, 1938 bbis & YF125ST gel
11158-11286 38,800#20-40 sand & 19,000#20-40 SBXL sand, 2334 bbis Slickwater
10766-10993 21,000#20-40 sand & 50,500#20-40 SBXL sand, 1261 bbis Clear Frac
10350-10355 No Frac

9308-9412 19,000#20-40 sand & 51,800#20-40 SBXL sand, 2576 bbis Slickwater
6782-6910 54,350# 20-40 sand & 40,950# 20-40 SBXL sand, 2788 bbis Slickwater

28. Production - Interval A-G Commingled Lower Mesaverde, Mesaverde, Dark Canyon and Wasatch

Date First Test Date Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method

Produced Tested Producti BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

07/24/04 08/05/04 24 17 1,517 396 55 Flowing
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg.

Size Flwg Press.

18/64" si 500 1150 + 17 1517 396 55 Producing
28

Date First Test Date Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Tested Producti BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press.

Size Flwg

> RECEIVED
(See instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)



28b.
.DatÅit Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas ty Production Method

a Produce Date Tested Production B MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

28b. Production
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Pro BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Sold, used forfuel,vented, etc.)

Sold
30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem

tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures

and recoveries.

TopFormation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas. Depth

Uintah Surface 5,484

Wasatch 5,484 9,292

Mesaverde 9,292 10,868

Lower Mesaverdt 10,868 11,800 TD @ 11,800' within Mesaverde

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:

1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) OngWell Title Operations Manager
Signature Date September 8, 2004

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Ti U.S.C. See n 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or frau t statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

RECEIVED
o U.S. GPO: 1999-573-62

JUL1 12005
DIV.0F0lL,GAS&

28b.
.DatÅit Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas ty Production Method

a Produce Date Tested Production B MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

28b. Production

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Gravity Production Method
Produced Date Tested Pro BBL MCF BBL Corr. API

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas : Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas (Sold, used forfuel,vented, etc.)

Sold
30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem

tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures

and recoveries.

TopFormation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name
Meas. Depth

Uintah Surface 5,484

Wasatch 5,484 9,292

Mesaverde 9,292 10,868

Lower Mesaverdt 10,868 11,800 TD @ 11,800' within Mesaverde

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):

33. Circle enclosed attachments:

1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 5. Core Analysis 7. Other

36. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions)*

Name (please print) OngWell Title Operations Manager
Signature Date September 8, 2004

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Ti U.S.C. See n 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or frau t statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

RECEIVED
o U.S. GPO: 1999-573-62

JUL1 12005
DIV.0F0lL,GAS&



Form3160 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31.2007

5 Lease Senal No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-78433
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian. Allottee, or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 316 3 (APD) for such proposals. N A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No

i Type of Well
NA

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8 Well Name and No

2 NameofOperator Federal 11-21-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b Phone No (melude area code) 43-047-34608
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 I 12 | 303-483-0044 10 Field and Poot or Exploratory Area

4 LocationofWellfloolage.Sec.T.R.&f.orSurverl)esenpr><»U Riverbend
I 1 County or Pansh. Stale

577' FNI & 522' FWL NW NW of Section 2 I-T9S-R19E
lJintah County, IJtah

12. CI IECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTilER DATA

TYPli OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Nolice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Production (Staril Resume) Water Shui-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treal Reclamation Well Inlegrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplele Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Waler Disposal

\3 Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, includmg estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate dumtion thereof
If the proposal is to deepen dirœtronally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true venical depths of all pertinent markers and zones

Anach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide lhe Bond No on Iile with BI.M/BIA Required substquent reports shall be filed withm 30 days
followmg completion of the involved operations If the operation results in a multiple complelion or recompletion m a new interval, a Fonn 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed Final Abandonment Noliœs shall be filed only afics all requirements. including oclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

This is to irgorm you that we wi/I be disposing of water from this well as follows:

All produced water fi om this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
Brennan bottom Water Disposal located between Roosevelt and Vernal Utah.

Accepted by the

Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY AP

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is Irne and correct.

Name (l'rmred Tiped)
Title

Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Signgture Dale

y , y L/ / . , ,/ April 20, 2006
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Condinons of approvat if any are attached Approval of this nolice does not warrant or

cernfy that the applicani holds legal or equitable litle lo those nghts in the subject lease Office

which would enntle lhe applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 USC Section 1001 AND Title 43 US C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any depanment or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its gunsdiction
(Invinicuans em page

Form3160 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31.2007

5 Lease Senal No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-78433
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian. Allottee, or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 316 3 (APD) for such proposals. N A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No

i Type of Well
NA

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8 Well Name and No

2 NameofOperator Federal 11-21-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b Phone No (melude area code) 43-047-34608
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 I 12 | 303-483-0044 10 Field and Poot or Exploratory Area

4 LocationofWellfloolage.Sec.T.R.&f.orSurverl)esenpr><»U Riverbend
I 1 County or Pansh. Stale

577' FNI & 522' FWL NW NW of Section 2 I-T9S-R19E
lJintah County, IJtah

12. CI IECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTilER DATA

TYPli OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Nolice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Production (Staril Resume) Water Shui-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treal Reclamation Well Inlegrity

Subsequent Report Casing Repair New Construction Recomplele Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to Injection Plug back Waler Disposal

\3 Descnbe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, includmg estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate dumtion thereof
If the proposal is to deepen dirœtronally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true venical depths of all pertinent markers and zones

Anach the Bond unda which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on Iile with BI.M/BIA Required substquent reports shall be filed withm 30 days
followmg completion of the involved operations If the operation results in a multiple complelion or recompletion m a new interval, a Fonn 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed Final Abandonment Noliœs shall be filed only afics all ru¡uirements. including oclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

This is to irgorm you that we wi/I be disposing of water from this well as follows:

All produced water fi om this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at
Brennan bottom Water Disposal located between Roosevelt and Vernal Utah.

Accepted by the

Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FORRECORDONLY AP

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is Irne and correct.

Name (l'rmred Tiped)
Title

Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Signgture Dale

y , y L/ / . , ,/ April 20, 2006
THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Condinons of approvat if any are attached Approval of this nolice does not warrant or

cernfy that the applicani holds legal or equitable litle lo those nghts in the subject lease Office

which would enntle lhe applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 USC Section 1001 AND Title 43 US C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any depanment or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its gunsdiction

(Invinicuans em page



Form 3160- s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

prii2oon DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5 Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-78433

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. N A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

1 TypeofWell NA
Oil well Gas Well other 8 Well Name and No.

NameofOperalor Eeder3| ||-2I-9-|9
Gasco Production Company 9 ^PI Well No.

3a Address 3b Phone No. (melrule area code) 43-047-34608
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10 Eieldand Poot-or Exploratory^rea

i 1 ocanon of Well (I colage. Nec . T. R . il .
or Survey I)escrrpoon) Riverbend

I l. County or Parish. State
577' FNI & 522' FWL NW NW of Section 21-T9S-R19E

tJintah County, Utah
12. CilECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATI NATt)RE: OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTlfl R DATA

TYPI OF SllllMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inteni Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Eracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrily

Subsequeni Report Casing Repan New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Fmal Abandonment Notice Conver! Io In¡ecnon Plug back Water Disposal

13 Desenhe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated staning date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
if the proposal is to deepen dirœtionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme venical depths of all peninent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent repons shall be filed withm 30 days
followmg completion of the involved operations If the operation results m a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval a Eonn 3160-4 shall be filed once
testmg has been completed Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready Ior final inspection

This well was started on production on 7/24/04.

APR2 62006

14 I bereby certify ihai the foregoing is inie and correct

Name (Prmied liped)
Tille

Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Signature ) ,
,
// Date

/ / / _«_y .

,/ft April 20, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approvat if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable lille lo those rights in the subjeci lease Oflice
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Section 1001 AND Tille 43 US C. Section 1212, make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any maner within its junsdiction,
finsirnenons on page

Form 3160- s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

prii2oon DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5 Lease Serial No.
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-78433

Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an 6 If Indian. Allottee. or Tribe Name
abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. N A

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

1 TypeofWell NA
Oil well Gas Well other 8 Well Name and No.

NameofOperalor Eeder3| ||-2I-9-|9
Gasco Production Company 9 ^PI Well No.

3a Address 3b Phone No. (melrule area code) 43-047-34608
8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80112 303-483-0044 10 Eieldand Poot-or Exploratory^rea

i 1 ocanon of Well (I colage. Nec . T. R . il .
or Survey I)escrrpoon) Riverbend

I l. County or Parish. State
577' FNI & 522' FWL NW NW of Section 21-T9S-R19E

tJintah County, Utah
12. CilECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATI NATt)RE: OF NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTlfl R DATA

TYPI OF SllllMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inteni Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Eracture Treat Reclamation Well Integrily

Subsequeni Report Casing Repan New Construction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Fmal Abandonment Notice Conver! Io In¡ecnon Plug back Water Disposal

13 Desenhe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated staning date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
if the proposal is to deepen dirœtionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and tme venical depths of all peninent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on file with BLM/BIA Required subsequent repons shall be filed withm 30 days
followmg completion of the involved operations If the operation results m a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval a Eonn 3160-4 shall be filed once
testmg has been completed Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready Ior final inspection

This well was started on production on 7/24/04.

APR2 62006

14 I bereby certify ihai the foregoing is inie and correct

Name (Prmied liped)
Tille

Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Signature ) ,
,
// Date

/ / / _«_y .

,/ft April 20, 2006

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approvat if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable lille lo those rights in the subjeci lease Oflice
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Section 1001 AND Tille 43 US C. Section 1212, make il a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any maner within its junsdiction,
finsirnenons on page



vonn3:eo-s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5 Lease Serial No
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS LJTL)-78433

Do not use this form for proposals to driu or to re-enteran 6 If Indian. Allottee.or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. N A
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

I TypeofWell NA

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8 Well Name and No.

2 NameofOperator Federal i 1-21-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b Phone No (meludr arca rade) 43-047-34608
8 inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 I 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 I ocation of Well {F<n>tage. See . T . IL Ai . or Surver />escripuun) Riverbend
11 Connly or Parish. State

577' FNL & 522' FWL NW NW of Section 21-T9S-R19E
.

LJmtah Lounty, IJtah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATI BOX(S) TO INDICATil NATllRii ()F NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPI OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shul-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integnty

Subsequent Report Casing Repan New Consituchon Recompleic Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon EFM Meter

Final Abandonmen! Nolice Convert to Inlection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Descnbe Proposed or CompletedOperalions (clearly state all pertineni details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and ime verlical depths of all peninent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on tile with Bl.M/BIA Required subsequent icports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations If Ihe opemtion itsults in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316 4 shall be filed once
lesling has been completed Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamalion, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 35oo) to measure production from this well and wi/I be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

APR2 62006

14 i hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Prmted 7pped)
Tille

Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Date
April 20, 2006

T S SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrani or

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Ollice
which would eniille the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 Uif Section 1001 AND Title 43 U S.C Section 1212. make it a cnme for any person knowingly and willfully to make any depanment or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any maner within its jurisdiction
(Instructwns on page

vonn3:eo-s UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires March31,2007

5 Lease Serial No
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS LJTL)-78433

Do not use this form for proposals to driu or to re-enteran 6 If Indian. Allottee.or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. N A
SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instructions on reverse side. 7 If Unit or CA Agreement Name and/or No

I TypeofWell NA

Oil Well Gas Well Other 8 Well Name and No.

2 NameofOperator Federal i 1-21-9-19
Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No

3a Address 3b Phone No (meludr arca rade) 43-047-34608
8 inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 80 I 12 303-483-0044 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4 I ocation of Well {F<n>tage. See . T . IL Ai . or Surver />escripuun) Riverbend
11 Connly or Parish. State

577' FNL & 522' FWL NW NW of Section 21-T9S-R19E
.

LJmtah Lounty, IJtah
12. CHECK APPROPRIATI BOX(S) TO INDICATil NATllRii ()F NOTICE. REPORT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPI OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shul-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integnty

Subsequent Report Casing Repan New Consituchon Recompleic Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon EFM Meter

Final Abandonmen! Nolice Convert to Inlection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Descnbe Proposed or CompletedOperalions (clearly state all pertineni details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and ime verlical depths of all peninent markers and zones
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No on tile with Bl.M/BIA Required subsequent icports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations If Ihe opemtion itsults in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316 4 shall be filed once
lesling has been completed Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamalion, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection

This sundry is being sent to inform you that we will be using a Ferguson Beauregard EFM
(Model 35oo) to measure production from this well and wi/I be considered as the point of
sale for gas produced from this well. A temperature probe has been installed for gas
measurement purposes. This unit does have a digital readout display and will be inspected
and proved according to all BLM regulations.

APR2 62006

14 i hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.

Name (Prmted 7pped)
Tille

Beverly Walker Engineering Technician

Date
April 20, 2006

T S SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrani or

certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Ollice
which would eniille the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 Uif Section 1001 AND Title 43 U S.C Section 1212. make it a cnme for any person knowingly and willfully to make any depanment or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any maner within its jurisdiction
(Instructwns on page



Form3160-5
UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED(August 1999)

OMBNo 1004-Ol35DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ExpiresJnovember30.2000
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5 lease Serial No

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-78433Do not use thisform for proposals to driH or reenteran 6 Iffndian,AllotteeorTribeNameabandoned weH. Use Form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals- NA
7 If Unit or CA/Agreement Name and/or NoSUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse s¡de

i Type of Well NA
Oil Well Gas Well Other 8 Well Name and No.

2 Name of Operator
Federal 11-21-9-19

Gasco Production Company 9 API Well No.
3a Address 3b. PhoneNo.fincludeareacode) 4g-Ogg-gg6QS
8 Inverness Dr E, Englewood, Colorado Borr2 303-483- ¤44 10 Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area
4 I ocation of Well (Footage. See . T. IL M. or Survey Description)

RÍUerbend
I I County or Parish. State

577' F1VL& 522' FWL NW NW of Section 21-T9S-R19E
Uintah County, Utah

12. CilECK APPROPRIATl' BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTit'l REPORT. OR OTIII R DATA
TYPli OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

Notice of Inten! Acidize Deepen Q Production (Start/Resume) Water Shul-Off
Aller Casing Fracture Treat Q Reclamation Well IntegrilySubsequeni Report Casing Repair New Construction Q Recomplete Other
Change Plans Plug and Abandon Q Temporarily Abandon ( (IllÍÑYlff NCICTFinal Abandonment Notice Conven to Injection Plug Back O Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or (ompleted Operations (clearly state all pertinent details. including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereofIf the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete honzontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zonesAttach the liond under which the work will be performed or provide the I3ond No on file with Bl.M/IllA Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 daysfollowing completion of the involved operations If the operation results in a multipic completion or recompletion m a new interval a Fomi 316(L4 shall be filed oncetesting has been completed Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all retµ¡irements, including reclamation. have been completed. and the opemtor hasdetermined that the site isready for linal inspection

This well is scheduled to have the sales meter calibrated on April 26, 2006 at 3:r5p-nL

APR2 62006

14 I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct
Name (Prmied liped) Title

Beverhi Walker Engineering TechnicianSignature Date
/ / ,7 / / / / ( ( ÄþFII 20, 2OOÓ

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE UK
Approved by Title Dale

Condstrons of approvat ifanv. are attached Approval i s intice does noi rrant or OfÍiCCcertify that the appIrcant holds legal or equitable title to those nghts in the subject lease
which would ennile the appheant to conduct operations thereon

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United States anyfalse, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
fluviru< nons on reverw)

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining
For Record



GAsco ENERGY - FOdSTBI 11-Ž1-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah 2 -Ogg - 'S 9' dg
DAILY COMPLETION REÞORT

4/7/04 Huffman Enterprises building rd into loc. (SCE)

4/12/04 Rd work 90% finished. MI D-8 cat to build loc. (SCE)

4/15/04 Loc finished and still working on reserve pit. Haven't had to blast to build loc.
(SCE)

4/20/04 Finishing loc and pit today. Had to blast bottom of pit to get deep enough. (SCE)

4/23/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout rathole rig. Spudded well 9:00 AM 4/22/04. Ran 17 ¼'
hammer bit and air/foam drilled to conductor TD 230'. SDFN. (SCE)

4/24/04 RIH w/ guide shoe + 5 jts 13 3/8" 54.5# ST&C csg, to 223' GL. RU Halliburton.
cmt'ed csg back to surface w/ 210 sx Class "A" regular cmt. Approx 10 bbls cmt
returns to pit. SWIFN to let cmt set.

4/25/04 RIH w/ 12 ¼" bit. Pre drilled hole to 805'. Drilled rat and mouse hole. RDMOL.
(SCE)

5/8/04 Start moving Nabors rig 924 to location.

5/8/04 thru 5/11/04 Contiue moving rig 924 and rigging up same.

5/12/04 Raised Derrick, rig totally on location. Replaced both shale shakers with rebuilt
matching linear shakers. Rebuild choke manifold and replace worn out parts.

Federal 11-21-9-19 - Completion

7/20/04 RU SLB Wireline (Dwayne) and ran CBL/CCLIGamma Ray log. RU
Double Jack testing and psi tested csg to 9000 psi, ok. Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11590' -

92, 11606 - 08, 11634 - 36, 11652 - 55, 3 SPF w/ 3 3/8" Powerjet guns, .45 EHD,
38.6" pen, 22.7 gm chgs. Well ready to frac. DC 53946. CWC 1,492,766. (SCE)

7/21/2004 RU Schlumberger PS, Broke down Stage 1 at 5027psi. Pump 250 Bbls of 20# linear
gell and perform step rate test. ISIP 4402psi, 26 holes open. Frac Lower Mesaverde
with 17,950# of 20-40 sand and 11,850# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand, using 1631
total bbls of slickwater (includes 250 bbls of linear gell). ATP 6871psi at 45 BPM
Blender had poor control and pumped a high density sand spike causing well to
screen out with 9549psi. Shut down with 70 bbls of sand laden fluid in casing. Flow

SEP2 9 2 well back to pit until sand cleared up. Attempt to GIH to perforate Stage 2. STS

g ease injector would not pump grease. RD STS, RU Schlumberger low pressure

DIV.0FOILGAS&MI ipment, GIH and set a 8K Howco FTFP at 11550'. Perforate Stage 2 Mesaverde
11364'-370', 11476'-481', 11519'-524' 3SPF with a 3 3/8" Power Jet gun. Flow well
for 14 total hrs on a 14/64 ck with 900psi FCP and made 789 BF, BLWTR 842

7/22/04 RU Schlumberger PS. Broke down Stage 2 Mesaverde with 4214psi. Frac Stage 2
with 50,500# of 20-40 sand and 101500# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 1938

c:\UULUMt~1\UOMU5tK\LUCALN~1\1emp\reaeral 11-zi-y-19 va11ycompletiot1Keports.coc

Page 1

GAsco ENERGY - FOdSTBI 11-Ž1-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah 2 -Ogg - 'S 9' dg
DAILY COMPLETION REÞORT

4/7/04 Huffman Enterprises building rd into loc. (SCE)

4/12/04 Rd work 90% finished. MI D-8 cat to build loc. (SCE)

4/15/04 Loc finished and still working on reserve pit. Haven't had to blast to build loc.
(SCE)

4/20/04 Finishing loc and pit today. Had to blast bottom of pit to get deep enough. (SCE)

4/23/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout rathole rig. Spudded well 9:00 AM 4/22/04. Ran 17 ¼'
hammer bit and air/foam drilled to conductor TD 230'. SDFN. (SCE)

4/24/04 RIH w/ guide shoe + 5 jts 13 3/8" 54.5# ST&C csg, to 223' GL. RU Halliburton.
cmt'ed csg back to surface w/ 210 sx Class "A" regular cmt. Approx 10 bbls cmt
returns to pit. SWIFN to let cmt set.

4/25/04 RIH w/ 12 ¼" bit. Pre drilled hole to 805'. Drilled rat and mouse hole. RDMOL.
(SCE)

5/8/04 Start moving Nabors rig 924 to location.

5/8/04 thru 5/11/04 Contiue moving rig 924 and rigging up same.

5/12/04 Raised Derrick, rig totally on location. Replaced both shale shakers with rebuilt
matching linear shakers. Rebuild choke manifold and replace worn out parts.

Federal 11-21-9-19 - Completion

7/20/04 RU SLB Wireline (Dwayne) and ran CBL/CCLIGamma Ray log. RU
Double Jack testing and psi tested csg to 9000 psi, ok. Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11590' -

92, 11606 - 08, 11634 - 36, 11652 - 55, 3 SPF w/ 3 3/8" Powerjet guns, .45 EHD,
38.6" pen, 22.7 gm chgs. Well ready to frac. DC 53946. CWC 1,492,766. (SCE)

7/21/2004 RU Schlumberger PS, Broke down Stage 1 at 5027psi. Pump 250 Bbls of 20# linear
gell and perform step rate test. ISIP 4402psi, 26 holes open. Frac Lower Mesaverde
with 17,950# of 20-40 sand and 11,850# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand, using 1631
total bbls of slickwater (includes 250 bbls of linear gell). ATP 6871psi at 45 BPM
Blender had poor control and pumped a high density sand spike causing well to
screen out with 9549psi. Shut down with 70 bbls of sand laden fluid in casing. Flow

SEP2 9 2 well back to pit until sand cleared up. Attempt to GIH to perforate Stage 2. STS

g ease injector would not pump grease. RD STS, RU Schlumberger low pressure

DIV.0FOILGAS&MI ipment, GIH and set a 8K Howco FTFP at 11550'. Perforate Stage 2 Mesaverde
11364'-370', 11476'-481', 11519'-524' 3SPF with a 3 3/8" Power Jet gun. Flow well
for 14 total hrs on a 14/64 ck with 900psi FCP and made 789 BF, BLWTR 842

7/22/04 RU Schlumberger PS. Broke down Stage 2 Mesaverde with 4214psi. Frac Stage 2
with 50,500# of 20-40 sand and 101500# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 1938

c:\UULUMt~1\UOMU5tK\LUCALN~1\1emp\reaeral 11-zi-y-19 va11ycompletiot1Keports.coc
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GAsco ENERGY - FOdOfåÊ - -Û-ŽÛ
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

bbls of Slickwater pad and YF125ST gell. ATP 6514psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4400psi.
RU Slb Wireline equip and set a Howco SK FTFP at 11300'. Perforate Stage 3
Mesaverde 11158'-162', 11186'-190', 11245'-248', 11284'-286'. Broke down with
5205 psi. Frac with 38,800# of 20-40 sand and 19,000# of 20-40 SBXL using 2334
bbls of Slickwater. ATP 7301psi at 59 BPM. ISIP 4580psi. GIH and set a 8K Howco
FTFP at 11010'. Had problems with sand sticking plug, pumped 10 bbls at 1 BPM
and freed up plug to set. Perforate stage 4 Mesaverde 10766'-768', 10816'-821',
10879'-882', 10990'-993'. Broke down stage 4 with 5948 psi, Frac stage 4 with
21,000# of 20-40 sand and 50,500# of 20-40 SBXL using 1261 bbls of Clear Frac.
ATP 5272psi at 51.8 BPM. ISIP 4165psi. Flow well for 9 hrs on a 16/64 ck.with
1050psi FCP and made 879 BF. TR 1668, BLWTR 5496.

7/23/2004 RU Schlumberger Wireline and STS 10K lubricator. GIH and perforate Mesaverde
10350'-355' 3 SPF. Did not frac this interval.GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at
9430'. Perforate Stage 5 Dark Canyon 9308'-314', 9406'-412' 3 SPF. Frac stage 5
with 19,000# of sand and 51,800# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2576 bbls of Slickwater.
ATP 6059psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 3600psi. RU wireline and attempt to run a Howco 8K
FTFP, plug came apart and stuck in frac head. Disassemble and remove pieces of
plug. GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 6926'. Perforate Stage 6 Wasatch 6782'-
787', 6898'-900', 6907'-910'. RU Slb PS. Broke down Wasatch with 5156psi. Frac
with 54,350# of 20-40 sand and 40,950# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 2788
bbls of Slickwater. ATP 4719psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 1562. Very erratic Pressure plot.
Flowed well on a 14 then 16 then 20/64ck with 100psi final FCP and made 787 BF,
TR 2255BF, BLWTR 10073 BF.
DC $ 537,176 CC $2,029,942

7/24/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 700 FCP on 20/64" ck. Flowed 787 bbls in 10 hrs. TR
2455. BLWTR 10073. DC $16,918. CWC $2,046,860. (SCE)

Run tbg, Drill out FTFP's

7/25/04 7:00 AM, Well barely flowing @0 psi on open ek. Flowed 575 bbls in 24 hrs. TR
3030. BLWTR 9498. MIRU Pool rig 820 (Alex and Everitt). Water barely flowing
over top of valve. NU Weatherford BOP's. RIH w/ Varel 3 ¾" L-2 bit +

Weatherford pump off bit sub + XN nipple + 2 3/8" N-80/P110 tbg (f/ Aztec Pipe).
SD w/ bit @+-6700. Left well open to tk on small ck for night. DC $6220. CWC
$2,053,080. (SCE)

7/26/04 Fin RIH and tagged sd @6785'. RU Pool power swivel and circ cln to first FTFP @
6926'. Drill up plug and well kicked off flowing back again. Maintained 1500 psi
FCP w/ 40/64" to ¾" ck to pit. Continued to drill up FTFP's @9420', 11000',
11300', pumping wtr @1 bpm. RIH to last plug @11550'. Turned over to Premier
to flow back. DC $39,047. CWC $2,092,127.

7/27/04 Rig SD today to FB well. Well flowing back @2550 FCP, on 20/64" ck. Made 1810
bbls in 12 hrs. TR 4940. BLWTR 7588. DC $6852. CWC $2,098,979.

L:\UULUMt~1\UDIVIU3tK\LULAU>~1\Iemp\reaerat 11-zi-y-ly vany complettor1Keports.aoc
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GAsco ENERGY - FOdOfåÊ - -Û-ŽÛ
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

bbls of Slickwater pad and YF125ST gell. ATP 6514psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4400psi.
RU Slb Wireline equip and set a Howco SK FTFP at 11300'. Perforate Stage 3
Mesaverde 11158'-162', 11186'-190', 11245'-248', 11284'-286'. Broke down with
5205 psi. Frac with 38,800# of 20-40 sand and 19,000# of 20-40 SBXL using 2334
bbls of Slickwater. ATP 7301psi at 59 BPM. ISIP 4580psi. GIH and set a 8K Howco
FTFP at 11010'. Had problems with sand sticking plug, pumped 10 bbls at 1 BPM
and freed up plug to set. Perforate stage 4 Mesaverde 10766'-768', 10816'-821',
10879'-882', 10990'-993'. Broke down stage 4 with 5948 psi, Frac stage 4 with
21,000# of 20-40 sand and 50,500# of 20-40 SBXL using 1261 bbls of Clear Frac.
ATP 5272psi at 51.8 BPM. ISIP 4165psi. Flow well for 9 hrs on a 16/64 ck.with
1050psi FCP and made 879 BF. TR 1668, BLWTR 5496.

7/23/2004 RU Schlumberger Wireline and STS 10K lubricator. GIH and perforate Mesaverde
10350'-355' 3 SPF. Did not frac this interval.GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at
9430'. Perforate Stage 5 Dark Canyon 9308'-314', 9406'-412' 3 SPF. Frac stage 5
with 19,000# of sand and 51,800# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2576 bbls of Slickwater.
ATP 6059psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 3600psi. RU wireline and attempt to run a Howco 8K
FTFP, plug came apart and stuck in frac head. Disassemble and remove pieces of
plug. GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 6926'. Perforate Stage 6 Wasatch 6782'-
787', 6898'-900', 6907'-910'. RU Slb PS. Broke down Wasatch with 5156psi. Frac
with 54,350# of 20-40 sand and 40,950# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 2788
bbls of Slickwater. ATP 4719psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 1562. Very erratic Pressure plot.
Flowed well on a 14 then 16 then 20/64ck with 100psi final FCP and made 787 BF,
TR 2255BF, BLWTR 10073 BF.
DC $ 537,176 CC $2,029,942

7/24/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 700 FCP on 20/64" ck. Flowed 787 bbls in 10 hrs. TR
2455. BLWTR 10073. DC $16,918. CWC $2,046,860. (SCE)

Run tbg, Drill out FTFP's

7/25/04 7:00 AM, Well barely flowing @0 psi on open ek. Flowed 575 bbls in 24 hrs. TR
3030. BLWTR 9498. MIRU Pool rig 820 (Alex and Everitt). Water barely flowing
over top of valve. NU Weatherford BOP's. RIH w/ Varel 3 ¾" L-2 bit +

Weatherford pump off bit sub + XN nipple + 2 3/8" N-80/P110 tbg (f/ Aztec Pipe).
SD w/ bit @+-6700. Left well open to tk on small ck for night. DC $6220. CWC
$2,053,080. (SCE)

7/26/04 Fin RIH and tagged sd @6785'. RU Pool power swivel and circ cln to first FTFP @
6926'. Drill up plug and well kicked off flowing back again. Maintained 1500 psi
FCP w/ 40/64" to ¾" ck to pit. Continued to drill up FTFP's @9420', 11000',
11300', pumping wtr @1 bpm. RIH to last plug @11550'. Turned over to Premier
to flow back. DC $39,047. CWC $2,092,127.

7/27/04 Rig SD today to FB well. Well flowing back @2550 FCP, on 20/64" ck. Made 1810
bbls in 12 hrs. TR 4940. BLWTR 7588. DC $6852. CWC $2,098,979.
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GAsco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, RI9E

UIntah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

7/28/04 Well flowing back @1150 FCP, on 24/64" ck. Made 1193 bbls in 12 hrs. TR 6113.
BLWTR 6395. RIH to plug @11550' and drill up. Cont RIH and tag fill @11640'.
Cln out to PBTD @11731' (76' rat hole). PPOH and LD 163 jts. Landed tbg @
6669' w/ 206 jts. ND BOPE. NU tree. Broached tbg to SN. Dropped ball and
loaded tbg w/ 22 bbls. Pumped off bit and sub. Fld csg for 2 more hrs and cleaned
up. RD and ready to move. DC $28,647(inc build battery). CWC $2,127,626.

7/29/04 Well flowed back 720 bbls in 12 hrs, on 20/64" ck. TR 6845. BLWTR 5747. DC
$2000. CWC $2,129,626.

7/30/04 Well flowed back 497 bbls in 24 hrs, on 24/64" ek. TR 7350. BLWTR 5250.
Turned well dn line, thru separator and sold gas while continuing to cln up FB. DC
$2000. CWC $2,131,626.

8/2/04 SWI for psi build up. (SCE)

8/3/04 SI

8/4/04 Opened well up to sep for flow test. SITP 2700. SICP 2750.

8/5/04 Well flowing this AM w/ 500 FTP and 1150 CP. Made 1.517 MMCF in last 24 hrs.
396 BW and 17 BO on various eks. DC $2000. CWC $2,133,626. (SCE)

8/15/04 Late costs: build battery, wtr trucking, Frac tk rental, move tks. DC 31,919. CWC
2,165,545.

Federal 11-21-9-19

Run Production Log

10/17/04 RU Schlumberger Slick line unit (Scott Pitt-Evanston). Ran Memory Production
Log (on slickline). (SCE)

11/13/04 MIRU Temples Well serv. Opened csg to sales and blew well dn. Pumped 30 bbls
produced water dn tbg to quick kill. ND tree. NU BOPE. PU and RIH w/ 52 jts 2
3/8" N-80 tbg. Well kicked off flowing. Put dn line for night. (KF w/ Premier) DC
6305 CC 6305

11/14/04 Killed tbg and fin RIH. Tag fill @11746'. LD 4 jts and landed tbg @11622 w/ 367
jts. DN BOPE. NU tree. Tried to unload tbg to tk. No success. SWIFN. Turned
well over to pumpers. RDMOL. (KF w/ Premier) DC 4980. CC 11285

9/26/06 MORU service unit, lay pump and lines and pump 30 bbls down tbg. NDWH and NU
BOP. Pick up on tbg and pulled 15K over. Worked pipe for 15 min and tbg pulled free.
Start out of hole w/ tbg and BHA. POOH w/ 87 jts and shut down for day, leave well
open to sales. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 7758 CCC $ 19,043
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Gasco ENERGY - FedSTRI -Ž1-Û-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, RJ9E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMÞLETION REPORT

9/27/06 Well flowing this AM @600 psi. Pump 20 bb1sdown tbg and cont, POOH w/ tbg.
POOH w/ 276 jts (362 total) and BHA. Bottom 6 jts covered in light scale. Pick up 3 ¾
mill, X-over and RIH w/ tbg. RIH w/ 50 jts and rig up swab, RIH w/ sinker bars to find
bumper spring in tbg, found bumper spring 8 jts off bottom w/ sand line. Rig down swab
and POOH w/ tbg laying down last 10 jts. turn well down sales and shut down for day.
(CR) DC $ 6316 CCC $ 25,359

9/28/06 Well flowing this AM @200 psi. Pump 70 bb1sto control well, pick up 3 ¾ mill and X-
over. RIH w/ 290 jts and tag up @9290'. POOH w/ 64 jts laying down and RIH w/ 31
stands. Land well @9225' w/ 288 jts ( 75 total jts layed down from string ).RDMO
location. DC $ 6223 CCC $ 31,582
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Form 3160- 5 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

(April2004) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERlOR OMBNo 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: March 31, 2007

5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-78433
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to runter an 6. If Indian, Allottee, or Tribe Name

abandoned well. Use Form 31643 (APD) for such proposals.

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other Instmctions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA. Agreement Name and/or No.

I. Type of Well

Oil Well Gas weil other 8. Well Name and No.

2. Name of Operator See list below
Gasco Production Company 9. API Well No

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code)

8 Inverness Drive East Ste 100 Englewood, Co 801 12 | 303-483-0044 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory Area

4. Location of Well (Foolage. Sec . T. R. M. or Survey Description)

I l. County or Parish, State

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(S) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTlON

Nolice of Intent Acidize Deepen Production (Start/ Resume) Water Shut-off

Altering Casing Fracture Treat Reclamation Well Integnty

Subsequent Repoll Casing Repair New Constniction Recomplete Other

Change Plans Plug and abandon Temporarily Abandon

Final Abandonment Notice Convert to injection Plug back Water Disposal

13 Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (clearly state all pertinent details,including estimated starting dateof imy proposed work and approximate duration therof
if the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond unda which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA Required subscquent reports shall be flied within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the opemtion results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 316M shall be filed once
testing has been completed Final Abandonment Notiœs shall be filedonly afta all requirements, includingreclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that thesite is ready for linal inspection.

This is to inform you that effective immediately we will be disposing of produced
tvater fromtoells within this lease as follows:

All produced water from this well will be trucked off the location and disposed of at the Desert Spring
State Evaporation Facility NW 1/4 of Section 36-T9S-R18E Uintah County, Utah. WhicggtadlA)y the
Gasco Production Company. A copy of the approved permit for this facilityis attached· Utah

Oil, Gas and Min\n

FORRECORDOND
The tvells tvithin this lease are:
Federal 11-21-9-19 NW NW of Sec 21-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah o43-047-346o8
Federal 11-22-9-19 NW NW of Sec 22-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-35404

Federal 23-21-9-19 NE SW of Sec 21-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah o43-047-34199 RECE IVED
Lytham Fed 22-22-9-19 SE NW of Sec 22-T9S-R19E Uintah Cnty, Utah o43-047-34607

Federal 31-21-9-19 NW NE of Sec 21-T9S-RigE Uintah Cnty, Utah 043-047-35606

DIV.0F OIL,GAS&MINING
14. l hereby certify that the foregoingis true and correct

Name (Prmted 7pped)
Title

Beverly Walkep, Engineering Tech

Signatur Date
October i 8, 2006

THIS SPME FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Approved by Title Date
Conditions of approval, if any are attached Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease Ollice
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 AND Title 43 U S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitiousorfraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.
(Instructions on page
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Gasco ENERGY - FOdOral 11-ŽŽ-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMÞLETION REPORT

4/7/04 Huffman Enterprises building rd into loc. (SCE)

4/12/04 Rd work 90% finished. MI D-8 cat to build loc. (SCE)

4/15/04 Loc finished and still working on reserve pit. Haven't had to blast to build loc.
(SCE)

4/20/04 Finishing loc and pit today. Had to blast bottom of pit to get deep enough. (SCE)

4/23/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout rathole rig. Spudded well 9:00 AM 4/22/04. Ran 17 ¼'
hammer bit and air/foam drilled to conductor TD 230'. SDFN. (SCE)

4/24/04 RIH w/ guide shoe + 5 jts 13 3/8" 54.5# ST&C csg, to 223' GL. RU Halliburton.
cmt'ed esg back to surface w/ 210 sx Class "A" regular cmt. Approx 10 bbls emt
returns to pit. SWIFN to let cmt set.

4/25/04 RIH w/ 12 ¼" bit. Pre drilled hole to 805'. Drilled rat and mouse hole. RDMOL.
(SCE)

5/8/04 Start moving Nabors rig 924 to location.

5/8/04 thru 5/11/04 Contiue moving rig 924 and rigging up same.

5/12/04 Raised Derrick, rig totally on location. Replaced both shale shakers with rebuilt
matching linear shakers. Rebuild choke manifold and replace worn out parts.

Federal 11-21-9-19 - Completion

7/20/04 RU SLB Wireline (Dwayne) and ran CBLICCLIGamma Ray log. RU
Double Jack testing and psi tested csg to 9000 psi, ok. Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11590' -

92, 11606 - 08, 11634 - 36, 11652 - 55, 3 SPF w/ 3 3/8" Powerjet guns, .45 EHD,
38.6" pen, 22.7 gm chgs. Well ready to frac. DC 53946. CWC 1,492,766. (SCE)

7/21/2004 RU Schlumberger PS, Broke down Stage 1 at 5027psi. Pump 250 Bbls of 20# linear
gell and perform step rate test. ISIP 4402psi, 26 holes open. Frac Lower Mesaverde
with 17,950# of 20-40 sand and 11,850# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand, using 1631
total bbls of slickwater (includes 250 bbls of linear gell). ATP 6871psi at 45 BPM
Blender had poor control and pumped a high density sand spike causing well to

RECElVEDscreen out with 9549psi. Shut down with 70 bbls of sand laden fluid in casing. Flow
well back to pit until sand cleared up. Attempt to GIH to perforate Stage 2. STS

DEC1 4 2006grease injector would not pump grease. RD STS, RU Schlumberger low pressure
eauipment, GIH and set a 8K Howco FTFP at 11550'. Perforate Stage 2 Mesaverde

Div.0FOIL,GAS&MINiŸ364'-370',11476'-481', 11519'-524' 3SPF with a 3 3/8" Power Jet gun. Flow well
for 14 total hrs on a 14/64 ck with 900psi FCP and made 789 BF, BLWTR 842

7/22/04 RU Schlumberger PS. Broke down Stage 2 Mesaverde with 4214psi. Frac Stage 2
with 50,500# of 20-40 sand and 101500# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 1938
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GAsco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T95, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

bbls of Slickwater pad and YF125ST gell. ATP 6514psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4400psi.
RU Slb Wireline equip and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 11300'. Perforate Stage 3
Mesaverde 11158'-162', 11186'-190', 11245'-248', 11284'-286'. Broke down with
5205 psi. Frac with 38,800# of 20-40 sand and 19,000# of 20-40 SBXL using 2334
bbls of Slickwater. ATP 7301psi at 59 BPM. ISIP 4580psi. GIH and set a 8K Howco
FTFP at 11010'. Had problems with sand sticking plug, pumped 10 bbls at 1 BPM
and freed up plug to set. Perforate stage 4 Mesaverde 10766'-768', 10816'-821',
10879'-882', 10990'-993'. Broke down stage 4 with 5948 psi, Frac stage 4 with
21,000# of 20-40 sand and 50,500# of 20-40 SBXL using 1261 bbls of Clear Frac.
ATP 5272psi at 51.8 BPM. ISIP 4165psi. Flow well for 9 hrs on a 16/64 ck.with
1050psi FCP and made 879 BF. TR 1668, BLWTR 5496.

7/23/2004 RU Schlumberger Wireline and STS 10K lubricator. GIH and perforate Mesaverde
10350'-355' 3 SPF. Did not frac this interval.GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at
9430'. Perforate Stage 5 Dark Canyon 9308'-314', 9406'-412' 3 SPF. Frac stage 5
with 19,000# of sand and 51,800# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2576 bbls of Slickwater.
ATP 6059psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 3600psi. RU wireline and attempt to run a Howco 8K
FTFP, plug came apart and stuck in frac head. Disassemble and remove pieces of
plug. GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 6926'. Perforate Stage 6 Wasatch 6782'-
787', 6898'-900', 6907'-910'. RU Slb PS. Broke down Wasatch with 5156psi. Frac
with 54,350# of 20-40 sand and 40,950# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 2788
bbls of Slickwater. ATP 4719psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 1562. Very erratic Pressure plot.
Flowed well on a 14 then 16 then 20/64ck with 100psi final FCP and made 787 BF,
TR 2255BF, BLWTR 10073 BF.
DC $ 537,176 CC $2,029,942

7/24/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 700 FCP on 20/64" ck. Flowed 787 bbls in 10 hrs. TR
2455. BLWTR 10073. DC $16,918. CWC $2,046,860. (SCE)

Run tbg, Drill out FTFP's

7/25/04 7:00 AM, Well barely flowing @0 psi on open ck. Flowed 575 bbls in 24 hrs. TR
3030. BLWTR 9498. MIRU Pool rig 820 (Alex and Everitt). Water barely flowing
over top of valve. NU Weatherford BOP's. RIH w/ Varel 3 ¾" L-2 bit +

Weatherford pump off bit sub + XN nipple + 2 3/8" N-80/P110 tbg (f/ Aztec Pipe).
SD w/ bit @+-6700. Left well open to tk on small ek for night. DC $6220. CWC
$2,053,080. (SCE)

7/26/04 Fin RIH and tagged sd @6785'. RU Pool power swivel and circ cln to first FTFP @
6926'. Drill up plug and well kicked off flowing back again. Maintained 1500 psi
FCP w/ 40/64" to ¾" ck to pit. Continued to drill up FTFP's @9420', 11000',
11300', pumping wtr @1 bpm. RIH to last plug @11550'. Turned over to Premier
to flow back. DC $39,047. CWC $2,092,127.

7/27/04 Rig SD today to FB well. Well flowing back @2550 FCP, on 20/64" ck. Made 1810
bbls in 12 hrs. TR 4940. BLWTR 7588. DC $6852. CWC $2,098,979.
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DAILY COMPLETION REPORT
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11300', pumping wtr @1 bpm. RIH to last plug @11550'. Turned over to Premier
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GAsco ENERGY - FOdSTBA 1-Ž1-9-1Û
NE/NW Sec. 21, TOS, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

7/28/04 Well flowing back @1150 FCP, on 24/64" ck. Made 1193 bbls in 12 hrs. TR 6113.
BLWTR 6395. RIH to plug @11550' and drill up. Cont RIH and tag fill @11640'.
Cln out to PBTD @11731' (76' rat hole). PPOH and LD 163 jts. Landed tbg @
6669' w/ 206 jts. ND BOPE. NU tree. Broached tbg to SN. Dropped ball and
loaded tbg w/ 22 bbls. Pumped off bit and sub. Fld esg for 2 more hrs and cleaned
up. RD and ready to move. DC $28,647 (inc build battery). CWC $2,127,626.

7/29/04 Well flowed back 720 bbls in 12 hrs, on 20/64" ck. TR 6845. BLWTR 5747. DC
$2000. CWC $2,129,626.

7/30/04 Well flowed back 497 bbls in 24 hrs, on 24/64" ck. TR 7350. BLWTR 5250.
Turned well dn line, thru separator and sold gas while continuing to cln up FB. DC
$2000. CWC $2,131,626.

8/2/04 SWI for psi build up. (SCE)

8/3/04 SI

8/4/04 Opened well up to sep for flow test. SITP 2700. SICP 2750.

8/5/04 Well flowing this AM w/ 500 FTP and 1150 CP. Made 1.517 MMCF in last 24 hrs.
396 BW and 17 BO on various eks. DC $2000. CWC $2,133,626. (SCE)

8/15/04 Late costs: build battery, wtr trucking, Frac tk rental, move tks. DC 31,919. CWC
2,165,545.

Federal 11-21-9-19

Run Production Log

10/17/04 RU Schlumberger Slick line unit (Scott Pitt-Evanston). Ran Memory Production
Log (on slickline). (SCE)

11/13/04 MIRU Temples Well serv. Opened csg to sales and blew well dn. Pumped 30 bbls
produced water dn tbg to quick kill. ND tree. NU BOPE. PU and RIH w/ 52 jts 2
3/8" N-80 tbg. Well kicked off flowing. Put dn line for night. (KF w/ Premier) DC
6305 CC 6305

11/14/04 Killed tbg and fin RIH. Tag fill @11746'. LD 4 jts and landed tbg @11622 w/ 367
jts. DN BOPE. NU tree. Tried to unload tbg to tk. No success. SWIFN. Turned
well over to pumpers. RDMOL. (KF w/ Premier) DC 4980. CC 11285

9/26/06 MORU service unit, lay pump and lines and pump 30 bbls down tbg. NDWH and NU
BOP. Pick up on tbg and pulled 15K over. Worked pipe for 15 min and tbg pulled free.
Start out of hole w/ tbg and BHA. POOH w/ 87 jts and shut down for day, leave well
open to sales. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 7758 CCC $ 19,043
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9/26/06 MORU service unit, lay pump and lines and pump 30 bbls down tbg. NDWH and NU
BOP. Pick up on tbg and pulled 15K over. Worked pipe for 15 min and tbg pulled free.
Start out of hole w/ tbg and BHA. POOH w/ 87 jts and shut down for day, leave well
open to sales. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 7758 CCC $ 19,043

c:\vutuivie~1\UUlVIUbtK\LULALa~1uemp\reaeral 11-zi-y-19 vany compteuon Keports.aoc

Page 3 of



Gasco ENERGY - FOdBTBI 11-ZZ-Û-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETZON REPORT

9/27/06 Well flowing this AM @600 psi. Pump 20 bbls down tbg and cont, POOH w/ tbg.
POOH w/ 276 jts (362 total) and BHA. Bottom 6 jts covered in light scale. Pick up 3 ¾
mill, X-over and RIH w/ tbg. RIH w/ 50 jts and rig up swab, RIH w/ sinker bars to find
bumper spring in tbg, found bumper spring 8 jts off bottom w/ sand line. Rig down swab
and POOH w/ tbg laying down last 10 jts. turn well down sales and shut down for day.
(CR) DC $ 6316 CCC $ 25,359

9/28/06 Well flowing this AM @200 psi. Pump 70 bb1sto control well, pick up 3 ¾ mill and X-
over. RIH w/ 290 jts and tag up @9290'. POOH w/ 64 jts laying down and RIH w/ 31
stands. Land well @9225' w/ 288 jts ( 75 total jts layed down from string ).RDMO
location. DC $ 6223 CCC $ 31,582

12/2/06 MORU service unit, pump 30 bbls down tbg and NDWH and NU BOP. Leave casing
open to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 4644 CC $ 36,226

12/5/06 Rig up Maverick and break circ. RIH w/ 2 jts and tag up @9291' and start drilling. Drill
out 4 jts to 9423' and fall through. RIH w/ 40 jts and tag up @10,728', have to pull 20 k
over to pull free. Circulate bottoms up and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 18,903
CC $55,129

12/6/06 Pump 20 bbls down tbg. Maverick had trouble getting nitrogen motor started. Finally
running @9:30. Drill down to 10,758 and fall through, RIH w/ 21 jts and tag up @
11,401'. Drill down 37' in 3 hours, very hard scale. Cire bottoms up and SDFD. (Rick w/
Premier / CR) DC $ 18,203 CC $ 73,332

12/7/06 Open well up and pump 20 bbls down tbg to clear mill. Break circ and start drilling, drill
down to I1,444' and pin on kellycock valve parted. Drop tbg 15' and catch in slips, lay
down swivel and POOH w/ 1jt. Pick up 10' sub and break circ. Well circulated good but
tbg stuck. Work tbg with and with out torque while circ w/ no luck. Leave well flowing
and SDFD w/ 70k pulled into tbg. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 26,698 CC $ 100,030

12/8/06 Well flowing this AM @200 psi. Tbg still stuck, work tbg from neutral to 80k while
wireline rigged up. Pick up free point tool and RIH. could not get past 10,168'. Pick up
chemical cutter and cut TBG off @ l1,365' wireline depth. Rig down BWWC and
POOH w/ 144 jts. Leave esg to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 22,516
CC $ 122,546

12/9/06 Well flowing this AM @250 psi. Pump 30 bbls and continue POOH w/ tbg. Pull 48
stands and tongs hung up on collar. Lay down bent joints and wait for 3 hrs on new tongs.
Rig up new tongs and finish POOH. Leave well open to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/
Premier / CR) DC $ 5652 CC $ 128,198

12/10/06 Open well up and pick up BHA. RIH w/ tbg and latch on to fish. Start setting off jars and
trying to work fish loose. Jars failed after 6 hits, try to free fish with bumper sub with no
luck. Release overshot and start out of hole w/ tbg. Leave well open to sales and SDFD.
(Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 11,678 CC $ 139,867
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NE/NW Sec. 21, TOS, R19E
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DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

12/12/06 POOH w/ 344 jts tbg and change out jars and intensifier. RIH w/ BHA and latch onto fish
w/ 351 jts tbg, start jarring on fish. Unable to jar loose, leave well open to sales and
SDFD. DC $ 7438 CC $ 147,305

12/13/06 Well flowing this AM @200 psi. Break circ and start jarringon fish while circ bottoms
up. Release over shot and lay down 10 jts. ND BOP and NUWH, RDMO location. DC $
3707 CC $ 151,012
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Gasco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T95, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

4/7/04 Huffman Enterprises building rd into loc. (SCE)

4/12/04 Rd work 90% finished. MI D-8 cat to build loc. (SCE)

4/15/04 Loc finished and still working on reserve pit. Haven't had to blast to build loc.
(SCE)

4/20/04 Finishing loc and pit today. Had to blast bottom of pit to get deep enough. (SCE)

4/23/04 MIRU Craig's Roustabout rathole rig. Spudded well 9:00 AM 4/22/04. Ran 17 ¼'
hammer bit and air/foam drilled to conductor TD 230'. SDFN. (SCE)

4/24/04 RIH w/ guide shoe + 5 jts 13 3/8" 54.5# ST& C csg, to 223' GL. RU Halliburton.
cmt'ed csg back to surface w/ 210 sx Class "A" regular cmt. Approx 10 bbls cmt
returns to pit. SWIFN to let cmt set.

4/25/04 RIH w/ 12 ¼" bit. Pre drilled hole to 805'. Drilled rat and mouse hole. RDMOL.
(SCE)

5/8/04 Start moving Nabors rig 924 to location.

5/8/04 thru 5/11/04 Contiue moving rig 924 and rigging up same.

5/12/04 Raised Derrick, rig totally on location. Replaced both shale shakers with rebuilt
matching linear shakers. Rebuild choke manifold and replace worn out parts.

Federal 11-21-9-19 - Completion

7/20/04 RU SLB Wireline (Dwayne) and ran CBL/CCL/Gamma Ray log. RU
Double Jack testing and psi tested csg to 9000 psi, ok. Perforated Stage 1 f/ 11590' -

92, 11606 - 08, 11634 - 36, 11652 - 55, 3 SPF w/ 3 3/8" Powerjet guns, .45 EHD,
38.6" pen, 22.7 gm chgs. Well ready to frac. DC 53946. CWC 1,492,766. (SCE)

7/21/2004 RU Schlumberger PS, Broke down Stage 1 at 5027psi. Pump 250 Bbls of 20# linear
gell and perform step rate test. ISIP 4402psi, 26 holes open. Frac Lower Mesaverde
with 17,950# of 20-40 sand and 11,850# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand, using 1631

PECE IVED total bbls of slickwater (includes 250 bbls of linear gell). ATP 6871psi at 45 BPM

JANO8 2007 Blender had poor control and pumped a high density sand spike causing well to
screen out with 9549psi. Shut down with 70 bbls of sand laden fluid in casing. Flow
well back to pit until sand cleared up. Attempt to GIH to perforate Stage 2. STS
grease injector would not pump grease. RD STS, RU Schlumberger low pressure
equipment, GIH and set a 8K Howco FTFP at 11550'. Perforate Stage 2 Mesaverde
11364'-370', 11476'-481', 11519'-524' 3SPF with a 3 3/8" Power Jet gun. Flow well
for 14 total hrs on a 14/64 ek with 900psi FCP and made 789 BF, BLWTR 842

7/22/04 RU Schlumberger PS. Broke down Stage 2 Mesaverde with 4214psi. Frac Stage 2
with 50,500# of 20-40 sand and 101500# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 1938
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bbls of Slickwater pad and YF125ST gell. ATP 6514psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4400psi.
RU Slb Wireline equip and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 11300'. Perforate Stage 3
Mesaverde 11158'-162', 11186'-190', 11245'-248', 11284'-286'. Broke down with
5205 psi. Frac with 38,800# of 20-40 sand and 19,000# of 20-40 SBXL using 2334
bbls of Slickwater. ATP 7301psi at 59 BPM. ISIP 4580psi. GIH and set a 8K Howco
FTFP at 11010'. Had problems with sand sticking plug, pumped 10 bbls at 1 BPM
and freed up plug to set. Perforate stage 4 Mesaverde 10766'-768', 10816'-821',
10879'-882', 10990'-993'. Broke down stage 4 with 5948 psi, Frac stage 4 with
21,000# of 20-40 sand and 50,500# of 20-40 SBXL using 1261 bbls of Clear Frac.
ATP 5272psi at 51.8 BPM. ISIP 4165psi. Flow well for 9 hrs on a 16/64 ck.with
1050psi FCP and made 879 BF. TR 1668, BLWTR 5496.

7/23/2004 RU Schlumberger Wireline and STS 10K lubricator. GIH and perforate Mesaverde
10350'-355' 3 SPF. Did not frac this interval.GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at
9430'. Perforate Stage 5 Dark Canyon 9308'-314', 9406'-412' 3 SPF. Frac stage 5
with 19,000# of sand and 51,800# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2576 bbls of Slickwater.
ATP 6059psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 3600psi. RU wireline and attempt to run a Howco 8K
FTFP, plug came apart and stuck in frac head. Disassemble and remove pieces of
plug. GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 6926'. Perforate Stage 6 Wasatch 6782'-
787', 6898'-900', 6907'-910'. RU Slb PS. Broke down Wasatch with 5156psi. Frac
with 54,350# of 20-40 sand and 40,950# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 2788
bbls of Slickwater. ATP 4719psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 1562. Very erratic Pressure plot.
Flowed well on a 14 then 16 then 20/64ck with 100psi final FCP and made 787 BF,
TR 2255BF, BLWTR 10073 BF.
DC $ 537,176 CC $2,029,942

7/24/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 700 FCP on 20/64" ck. Flowed 787 bbls in 10 hrs. TR
2455. BLWTR 10073. DC $16,918. CWC $2,046,860. (SCE)

Run tbg, Drill out FTFP's

7/25/04 7:00 AM, Well barely flowing @0 psi on open ck. Flowed 575 bbls in 24 hrs. TR
3030. BLWTR 9498. MIRU Pool rig 820 (Alex and Everitt). Water barely flowing
over top of valve. NU Weatherford BOP's. RIH w/ Varel 3 ¾" L-2 bit +

Weatherford pump off bit sub + XN nipple + 2 3/8" N-80/P110 tbg (f/ Aztec Pipe).
SD w/ bit @+-6700. Left well open to tk on small ck for night. DC $6220. CWC
$2,053,080. (SCE)

7/26/04 Fin RIH and tagged sd @6785'. RU Pool power swivel and circ cln to first FTFP @
6926'. Drill up plug and well kicked off flowing back again. Maintained 1500 psi
FCP w/ 40/64" to ¾" ck to pit. Continued to drill up FTFP's @9420', 11000',
11300', pumping wtr @1 bpm. RIH to last plug @11550'. Turned over to Premier
to flow back. DC $39,047. CWC $2,092,127.

7/27/04 Rig SD today to FB well. Well flowing back @2550 FCP, on 20/64" ck. Made 1810
bbls in 12 hrs. TR 4940. BLWTR 7588. DC $6852. CWC $2,098,979.
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Gasco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T95, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

bbls of Slickwater pad and YF125ST gell. ATP 6514psi at 50 BPM. ISIP 4400psi.
RU Slb Wireline equip and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 11300'. Perforate Stage 3
Mesaverde 11158'-162', 11186'-190', 11245'-248', 11284'-286'. Broke down with
5205 psi. Frac with 38,800# of 20-40 sand and 19,000# of 20-40 SBXL using 2334
bbls of Slickwater. ATP 7301psi at 59 BPM. ISIP 4580psi. GIH and set a 8K Howco
FTFP at 11010'. Had problems with sand sticking plug, pumped 10 bbls at 1 BPM
and freed up plug to set. Perforate stage 4 Mesaverde 10766'-768', 10816'-821',
10879'-882', 10990'-993'. Broke down stage 4 with 5948 psi, Frac stage 4 with
21,000# of 20-40 sand and 50,500# of 20-40 SBXL using 1261 bbls of Clear Frac.
ATP 5272psi at 51.8 BPM. ISIP 4165psi. Flow well for 9 hrs on a 16/64 ck.with
1050psi FCP and made 879 BF. TR 1668, BLWTR 5496.

7/23/2004 RU Schlumberger Wireline and STS 10K lubricator. GIH and perforate Mesaverde
10350'-355' 3 SPF. Did not frac this interval.GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at
9430'. Perforate Stage 5 Dark Canyon 9308'-314', 9406'-412' 3 SPF. Frac stage 5
with 19,000# of sand and 51,800# of 20-40 SBXL sand using 2576 bbls of Slickwater.
ATP 6059psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 3600psi. RU wireline and attempt to run a Howco 8K
FTFP, plug came apart and stuck in frac head. Disassemble and remove pieces of
plug. GIH and set a Howco 8K FTFP at 6926'. Perforate Stage 6 Wasatch 6782'-
787', 6898'-900', 6907'-910'. RU Slb PS. Broke down Wasatch with 5156psi. Frac
with 54,350# of 20-40 sand and 40,950# of 20-40 SBXL resin coated sand using 2788
bbls of Slickwater. ATP 4719psi at 60 BPM. ISIP 1562. Very erratic Pressure plot.
Flowed well on a 14 then 16 then 20/64ck with 100psi final FCP and made 787 BF,
TR 2255BF, BLWTR 10073 BF.
DC $ 537,176 CC $2,029,942

7/24/04 7:00 AM, Well flowing w/ 700 FCP on 20/64" ck. Flowed 787 bbls in 10 hrs. TR
2455. BLWTR 10073. DC $16,918. CWC $2,046,860. (SCE)

Run tbg, Drill out FTFP's

7/25/04 7:00 AM, Well barely flowing @0 psi on open ck. Flowed 575 bbls in 24 hrs. TR
3030. BLWTR 9498. MIRU Pool rig 820 (Alex and Everitt). Water barely flowing
over top of valve. NU Weatherford BOP's. RIH w/ Varel 3 ¾" L-2 bit +

Weatherford pump off bit sub + XN nipple + 2 3/8" N-80/P110 tbg (f/ Aztec Pipe).
SD w/ bit @+-6700. Left well open to tk on small ck for night. DC $6220. CWC
$2,053,080. (SCE)

7/26/04 Fin RIH and tagged sd @6785'. RU Pool power swivel and circ cln to first FTFP @
6926'. Drill up plug and well kicked off flowing back again. Maintained 1500 psi
FCP w/ 40/64" to ¾" ck to pit. Continued to drill up FTFP's @9420', 11000',
11300', pumping wtr @1 bpm. RIH to last plug @11550'. Turned over to Premier
to flow back. DC $39,047. CWC $2,092,127.

7/27/04 Rig SD today to FB well. Well flowing back @2550 FCP, on 20/64" ck. Made 1810
bbls in 12 hrs. TR 4940. BLWTR 7588. DC $6852. CWC $2,098,979.
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GAsco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, TSS, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAZLY COAfPLETION REPORT

7/28/04 Well flowing back @1150 FCP, on 24/64" ck. Made 1193 bbls in 12 hrs. TR 6113.
BLWTR 6395. RIH to plug @11550' and drill up. Cont RIH and tag fill @11640'.
Cln out to PBTD @11731' (76' rat hole). PPOH and LD 163 jts. Landed tbg @
6669' w/ 206 jts. ND BOPE. NU tree. Broached tbg to SN. Dropped ball and
loaded tbg w/ 22 bbls. Pumped off bit and sub. Fld csg for 2 more hrs and cleaned
up. RD and ready to move. DC $28,647 (inc build battery). CWC $2,127,626.

7/29/04 Well flowed back 720 bbls in 12 hrs, on 20/64" ck. TR 6845. BLWTR 5747. DC
$2000. CWC $2,129,626.

7/30/04 Well flowed back 497 bbls in 24 hrs, on 24/64" ck. TR 7350. BLWTR 5250.
Turned well dn line, thru separator and sold gas while continuing to cln up FB. DC
$2000. CWC $2,131,626.

8/2/04 SWI for psi build up. (SCE)

8/3/04 SI

8/4/04 Opened well up to sep for flow test. SITP 2700. SICP 2750.

8/5/04 Well flowing this AM w/ 500 FTP and 1150 CP. Made 1.517 MMCF in last 24 hrs.
396 BW and 17 BO on various eks. DC $2000. CWC $2,133,626.(SCE)

8/15/04 Late costs: build battery, wtr trucking, Frac tk rental, move tks. DC 31,919. CWC
2,165,545.

Federal 11-21-9-19

Run Production Log

10/17/04 RU Schlumberger Slick line unit (Scott Pitt-Evanston). Ran Memory Production
Log (on slickline). (SCE)

11/13/04 MIRU Temples Well serv. Opened esg to sales and blew well dn. Pumped 30 bbls
produced water dn tbg to quick kill. ND tree. NU BOPE. PU and RIH w/ 52 jts 2
3/8" N-80 tbg. Well kicked off flowing. Put dn line for night. (KF w/ Premier) DC
6305 CC 6305

11/14/04 Killed tbg and fin RIH. Tag fill @11746'. LD 4 jts and landed tbg @11622 w/ 367
jts. DN BOPE. NU tree. Tried to unload tbg to tk. No success. SWIFN. Turned
well over to pumpers. RDMOL. (KF w/ Premier) DC 4980. CC 11285

9/26/06 MORU service unit, lay pump and lines and pump 30 bbls down tbg. NDWH and NU
BOP. Pick up on tbg and pulled 15K over. Worked pipe for 15 min and tbg pulled free.
Start out of hole w/ tbg and BHA. POOH w/ 87 jts and shut down for day, leave well
open to sales. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 7758 CCC $ 19,043
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GAsco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, TSS, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAZLY COAfPLETION REPORT

7/28/04 Well flowing back @1150 FCP, on 24/64" ck. Made 1193 bbls in 12 hrs. TR 6113.
BLWTR 6395. RIH to plug @11550' and drill up. Cont RIH and tag fill @11640'.
Cln out to PBTD @11731' (76' rat hole). PPOH and LD 163 jts. Landed tbg @
6669' w/ 206 jts. ND BOPE. NU tree. Broached tbg to SN. Dropped ball and
loaded tbg w/ 22 bbls. Pumped off bit and sub. Fld csg for 2 more hrs and cleaned
up. RD and ready to move. DC $28,647 (inc build battery). CWC $2,127,626.

7/29/04 Well flowed back 720 bbls in 12 hrs, on 20/64" ck. TR 6845. BLWTR 5747. DC
$2000. CWC $2,129,626.

7/30/04 Well flowed back 497 bbls in 24 hrs, on 24/64" ck. TR 7350. BLWTR 5250.
Turned well dn line, thru separator and sold gas while continuing to cln up FB. DC
$2000. CWC $2,131,626.

8/2/04 SWI for psi build up. (SCE)

8/3/04 SI

8/4/04 Opened well up to sep for flow test. SITP 2700. SICP 2750.

8/5/04 Well flowing this AM w/ 500 FTP and 1150 CP. Made 1.517 MMCF in last 24 hrs.
396 BW and 17 BO on various eks. DC $2000. CWC $2,133,626.(SCE)

8/15/04 Late costs: build battery, wtr trucking, Frac tk rental, move tks. DC 31,919. CWC
2,165,545.

Federal 11-21-9-19

Run Production Log

10/17/04 RU Schlumberger Slick line unit (Scott Pitt-Evanston). Ran Memory Production
Log (on slickline). (SCE)

11/13/04 MIRU Temples Well serv. Opened esg to sales and blew well dn. Pumped 30 bbls
produced water dn tbg to quick kill. ND tree. NU BOPE. PU and RIH w/ 52 jts 2
3/8" N-80 tbg. Well kicked off flowing. Put dn line for night. (KF w/ Premier) DC
6305 CC 6305

11/14/04 Killed tbg and fin RIH. Tag fill @11746'. LD 4 jts and landed tbg @11622 w/ 367
jts. DN BOPE. NU tree. Tried to unload tbg to tk. No success. SWIFN. Turned
well over to pumpers. RDMOL. (KF w/ Premier) DC 4980. CC 11285

9/26/06 MORU service unit, lay pump and lines and pump 30 bbls down tbg. NDWH and NU
BOP. Pick up on tbg and pulled 15K over. Worked pipe for 15 min and tbg pulled free.
Start out of hole w/ tbg and BHA. POOH w/ 87 jts and shut down for day, leave well
open to sales. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 7758 CCC $ 19,043
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GAsco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

9/27/06 Well flowing this AM @600 psi. Pump 20 bbls down tbg and cont, POOH w/ tbg.
POOH w/ 276 jts (362 total) and BHA. Bottom 6 jts covered in light scale. Pick up 3 ¾
mill, X-over and RIH w/ tbg. RIH w/ 50 jts and rig up swab, RIH w/ sinker bars to find
bumper spring in tbg, found bumper spring 8 jts off bottom w/ sand line. Rig down swab
and POOH w/ tbg laying down last 10 jts. turn well down sales and shut down for day.
(CR) DC $ 6316 CCC $ 25,359

9/28/06 Well flowing this AM @200 psi. Pump 70 bbls to control well, pick up 3 ¾ mill and X-
over. RIH w/ 290 jts and tag up @9290'. POOH w/ 64 jts laying down and RIH w/ 31
stands. Land well @9225' w/ 288 jts ( 75 total jts layed down from string ). RDMO
location. DC $ 6773 CCC $ 31,582

12/2/06 MORU service unit, pump 30 bbls down tbg and NDWH and NU BOP. Leave casing
open to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR ) DC $ 4644 CC $ 36,226

12/5/06 Rig up Maverick and break cire. RIH w/ 2 jts and tag up @9291' and start drilling. Drill
out 4 jts to 9423' and fall through. RIH w/ 40 jts and tag up @10,728', have to pull 20 k
over to pull free. Circulate bottoms up and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 18,903
CC $55,129

12/6/06 Pump 20 bb1sdown tbg. Maverick had trouble getting nitrogen motor started. Finally
running @9:30. Drill down to 10,758 and fall through, RIH w/ 21 jts and tag up @
l1,401'. Drill down 37' in 3 hours, very hard scale. Circ bottoms up and SDFD. (Rick w/
Premier / CR) DC $ 18,203 CC $ 73,332

12/7/06 Open well up and pump 20 bbls down tbg to clear mill. Break cire and start drilling, drill
down to 11,444' and pin on kellycock valve parted. Drop tbg 15' and catch in slips, lay
down swivel and POOH w/ 1 jt. Pick up 10' sub and break circ. Well circulated good but
tbg stuck. Work tbg with and with out torque while circ w/ no luck. Leave well flowing
and SDFD w/ 70k pulled into tbg. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 26,698 CC $ 100,030

12/8/06 Well flowing this AM @200 psi. Tbg still stuck, work tbg from neutral to 80k while
wireline rigged up. Pick up free point tool and RIH. could not get past 10,168'. Pick up
chemical cutter and cut TBG off @11,365' wireline depth. Rig down BWWC and
POOH w/ 144 jts. Leave csg to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 22,516
CC $ 122,546

12/9/06 Well flowing this AM @250 psi. Pump 30 bbls and continue POOH w/ tbg. Pull 48
stands and tongs hung up on collar. Lay down bent joints and wait for 3 hrs on new tongs.
Rig up new tongs and finish POOH. Leave well open to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/
Premier / CR) DC $ 5652 CC $ 128,198

12/10/06 Open well up and pick up BHA. RIH w/ tbg and latch on to fish. Start setting off jars and
trying to work fish loose. Jars failed after 6 hits, try to free fish with bumper sub with no
luck. Release overshot and start out of hole w/ tbg. Leave well open to sales and SDFD.
(Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 11,678 CC $ 139,867
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GAsco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

9/27/06 Well flowing this AM @600 psi. Pump 20 bbls down tbg and cont, POOH w/ tbg.
POOH w/ 276 jts (362 total) and BHA. Bottom 6 jts covered in light scale. Pick up 3 ¾
mill, X-over and RIH w/ tbg. RIH w/ 50 jts and rig up swab, RIH w/ sinker bars to find
bumper spring in tbg, found bumper spring 8 jts off bottom w/ sand line. Rig down swab
and POOH w/ tbg laying down last 10 jts. turn well down sales and shut down for day.
(CR) DC $ 6316 CCC $ 25,359

9/28/06 Well flowing this AM @200 psi. Pump 70 bbls to control well, pick up 3 ¾ mill and X-
over. RIH w/ 290 jts and tag up @9290'. POOH w/ 64 jts laying down and RIH w/ 31
stands. Land well @9225' w/ 288 jts ( 75 total jts layed down from string ). RDMO
location. DC $ 6773 CCC $ 31,582

12/2/06 MORU service unit, pump 30 bbls down tbg and NDWH and NU BOP. Leave casing
open to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR ) DC $ 4644 CC $ 36,226

12/5/06 Rig up Maverick and break cire. RIH w/ 2 jts and tag up @9291' and start drilling. Drill
out 4 jts to 9423' and fall through. RIH w/ 40 jts and tag up @10,728', have to pull 20 k
over to pull free. Circulate bottoms up and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 18,903
CC $55,129

12/6/06 Pump 20 bb1sdown tbg. Maverick had trouble getting nitrogen motor started. Finally
running @9:30. Drill down to 10,758 and fall through, RIH w/ 21 jts and tag up @
l1,401'. Drill down 37' in 3 hours, very hard scale. Circ bottoms up and SDFD. (Rick w/
Premier / CR) DC $ 18,203 CC $ 73,332

12/7/06 Open well up and pump 20 bbls down tbg to clear mill. Break cire and start drilling, drill
down to 11,444' and pin on kellycock valve parted. Drop tbg 15' and catch in slips, lay
down swivel and POOH w/ 1 jt. Pick up 10' sub and break circ. Well circulated good but
tbg stuck. Work tbg with and with out torque while circ w/ no luck. Leave well flowing
and SDFD w/ 70k pulled into tbg. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 26,698 CC $ 100,030

12/8/06 Well flowing this AM @200 psi. Tbg still stuck, work tbg from neutral to 80k while
wireline rigged up. Pick up free point tool and RIH. could not get past 10,168'. Pick up
chemical cutter and cut TBG off @11,365' wireline depth. Rig down BWWC and
POOH w/ 144 jts. Leave csg to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 22,516
CC $ 122,546

12/9/06 Well flowing this AM @250 psi. Pump 30 bbls and continue POOH w/ tbg. Pull 48
stands and tongs hung up on collar. Lay down bent joints and wait for 3 hrs on new tongs.
Rig up new tongs and finish POOH. Leave well open to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/
Premier / CR) DC $ 5652 CC $ 128,198

12/10/06 Open well up and pick up BHA. RIH w/ tbg and latch on to fish. Start setting off jars and
trying to work fish loose. Jars failed after 6 hits, try to free fish with bumper sub with no
luck. Release overshot and start out of hole w/ tbg. Leave well open to sales and SDFD.
(Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 11,678 CC $ 139,867
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GAsco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

12/12/06 POOH w/ 344 jts tbg and change out jars and intensifier. RIH w/ BHA and latch onto fish
w/ 351 jts tbg, start jarring on fish. Unable to jar loose, leave well open to sales and
SDFD. DC $ 7438 CC $ 147,305

12/13/06 Well flowing this AM @200 psi. Break circ and start jarring on fish while circ bottoms
up. Release over shot and lay down 10 jts. ND BOP and NUWH, RDMO location. DC $
3707 CC $ 151,012

12/19/06 MORU service unit, haul and set auxiliary equipment. SDFD ( CR) DC $ 5979 CC $
156,991

12/20/06 NDWH and NU BOP, RIH w/ 10 jts and catch fish top. Break cire and start jarring on
fish, jars failed after 3 ½ hrs. Release fishing tools and POOH w/ tbg. Close well in and
SDFD. (CR) DC $ 5813 CC $ 162,804

12/21/06 Open well up this AM and pick up 3 ¾ wash pipe and shoe and RIH w/ tbg. Tag up and
pick up swivel, break circulation and wash over fish. Made 6' and cire bottoms up,
POOH w/ 1 stands and close well in, SDFD (CR) DC $ 6734 CC $ 169,538

12/22/06 Open well up and RIH w/ 20 jts, tag up on fish and break circ. Circulate bottoms up and
POOH w/ tbg and wash pipe. Pick up 3 ¾ overshot and tools and RIH w/ 80 jts tbg.
Close well in and SDFD. (CR) DC $ 6734 CC $ 176,272

12/23/06 Open well up and finish RIH w/ tbg. Tag up on fish @ l1,336', while working over fish
fell 120'. Catch fish and POOH w/ tbg and BHA, lay down BHA and fish. Close well in
and SDFD. (CR) DC $ 4547 CC $ 183,006

12/27/06 Well pressured up to 800 psi this AM, blow down csg to sales and pump 60 bb1s.Well
pressured up, flowback to tank and recover 60 bbls. Pump 40 bbls down hole and RIH w/
3 ¾ mill, X-over, and 358 jts tbg. Tag up @ l1,506', rig up swivel and turn well down
sales for night. SDFD (CR) DC $6820 CC $ 189,740

12/28/06 Open well up with 200/200. RIH w/ 1 jt and tag up, break circ and start drilling. Clean
out to 11,546' and fall through. RIH w/ 4 jts to l1,708' (364 total) and cire bottoms up.
POOH w/ tbg and BHA, pick up notched collar, X-nipple and RIH w/ 208 jts. leave
casing to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 7638 CC $ 197,378

12/29/06 Open well up and finish RIH w/ 151 jts, broach tbg and land well @11,555 w/ 359 jts.
ND BOP and NUWH, rig up Maverick and try to blow well around w/ N2. rig up swab
and start swabbing, recover 18 bbls in 4 runs. Leave tbg to sales and shut down for night.
(Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $16,388 CC $ 213,766

12/30/06 Open well up and rig up swab. IFL 2800', made 25 runs and recovered 72 bbls. FFL
4000' with lots of grit in well bore, have to change cups every run. (Rick w/ Premier /
CR) DC 6773 CC $ 220,539
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GAsco ENERGY - Federal 11-21-9-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, T9S, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

12/12/06 POOH w/ 344 jts tbg and change out jars and intensifier. RIH w/ BHA and latch onto fish
w/ 351 jts tbg, start jarring on fish. Unable to jar loose, leave well open to sales and
SDFD. DC $ 7438 CC $ 147,305

12/13/06 Well flowing this AM @200 psi. Break circ and start jarring on fish while circ bottoms
up. Release over shot and lay down 10 jts. ND BOP and NUWH, RDMO location. DC $
3707 CC $ 151,012

12/19/06 MORU service unit, haul and set auxiliary equipment. SDFD ( CR) DC $ 5979 CC $
156,991

12/20/06 NDWH and NU BOP, RIH w/ 10 jts and catch fish top. Break cire and start jarring on
fish, jars failed after 3 ½ hrs. Release fishing tools and POOH w/ tbg. Close well in and
SDFD. (CR) DC $ 5813 CC $ 162,804

12/21/06 Open well up this AM and pick up 3 ¾ wash pipe and shoe and RIH w/ tbg. Tag up and
pick up swivel, break circulation and wash over fish. Made 6' and cire bottoms up,
POOH w/ 1 stands and close well in, SDFD (CR) DC $ 6734 CC $ 169,538

12/22/06 Open well up and RIH w/ 20 jts, tag up on fish and break circ. Circulate bottoms up and
POOH w/ tbg and wash pipe. Pick up 3 ¾ overshot and tools and RIH w/ 80 jts tbg.
Close well in and SDFD. (CR) DC $ 6734 CC $ 176,272

12/23/06 Open well up and finish RIH w/ tbg. Tag up on fish @ l1,336', while working over fish
fell 120'. Catch fish and POOH w/ tbg and BHA, lay down BHA and fish. Close well in
and SDFD. (CR) DC $ 4547 CC $ 183,006

12/27/06 Well pressured up to 800 psi this AM, blow down csg to sales and pump 60 bb1s.Well
pressured up, flowback to tank and recover 60 bbls. Pump 40 bbls down hole and RIH w/
3 ¾ mill, X-over, and 358 jts tbg. Tag up @ l1,506', rig up swivel and turn well down
sales for night. SDFD (CR) DC $6820 CC $ 189,740

12/28/06 Open well up with 200/200. RIH w/ 1 jt and tag up, break circ and start drilling. Clean
out to 11,546' and fall through. RIH w/ 4 jts to l1,708' (364 total) and cire bottoms up.
POOH w/ tbg and BHA, pick up notched collar, X-nipple and RIH w/ 208 jts. leave
casing to sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 7638 CC $ 197,378

12/29/06 Open well up and finish RIH w/ 151 jts, broach tbg and land well @11,555 w/ 359 jts.
ND BOP and NUWH, rig up Maverick and try to blow well around w/ N2. rig up swab
and start swabbing, recover 18 bbls in 4 runs. Leave tbg to sales and shut down for night.
(Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $16,388 CC $ 213,766

12/30/06 Open well up and rig up swab. IFL 2800', made 25 runs and recovered 72 bbls. FFL
4000' with lots of grit in well bore, have to change cups every run. (Rick w/ Premier /
CR) DC 6773 CC $ 220,539
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GAsco ENERGY - FOdSYSI 11-ŽÊ-Û-19
NE/NW Sec. 21, TOS, R19E

Uintah County, Utah
DAILY COMPLETION REPORT

12/31/06 Open well up w/ 100 / 1700 psi. Rig up swab and start swabbing, recover 82 bb1sin 28
runs. Fluid still very gritty have to change out cups every run. (Rick w/ Premier / CR)
DC $ 6136 CC $ 226,675

1/3/07 Open well up w/ 150/1700 psi. Rig up swab and recover 32 bbls in 12 runs, well started
flowing. Unload well to tank and try to turn down line, well died in 20 min. rig up swab
and make 1 run well started flowing, put tbg to sales and SDFD (Rick w/ Premier / CR)
DC $ 6918 CC $ 233,593

1/4/07 Well not flowing this AM. Rig up swab and make 5 runs recovering 30 bbls. Well kick
off flowing, watch well for 3 hrs and drop plunger, wait for 1 ½ hrs and cycle plunger.
Plunger up in 2 min no fluid, scale and rubber trapped around plunger. Rig up swab and
make 1 run, recovered no fluid and cup packed full of grit and rubber. Clean cups and
RIH w/ swab, recover 300' of fluid. Well on a vacuum after run, leave tbg to sales and
SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 6183 CC $ 239,776

1/5/07 open well up w/ 100/1700 psi , rig up swab and make 11 runs recovering 28 bbls and well
started flowing. Flow to tank and unload well recovering 50 bb1s (78 total). Put well to
sales and SDFD. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 6601 CC $ 246,377

1/6/07 Blow down tbg and drop plunger, rig up swab and make 5 runs recovering 20 bbls and
well kicked off flowing. Unload well to tank and shut well in for plunger run. Plunger
tripped in 22 min recovering 3 bbls of fluid. Turn well over to pumpers and RDMO
location. (Rick w/ Premier / CR) DC $ 5976 CC $ 252,353
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Division of Oil, Gas and Mining 

Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only 

Effective Date· 4/16/2015 
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERA TOR: 
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265 
7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts A venue, Suite 11500 
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237 
303-996-1805 303-996-1805 

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV 

WELL INFORMATION: 
Well Name API 
See Attached List 

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION: 
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015 
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015 
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143 

REVIEW: 
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: 
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015 
4. OPS/SIITA welles) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1120/2016 
5. VIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A 
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None 
7. Inspections ofPA statelfee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): 

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION: 
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 

2. Indian welles) covered by Bond Number: 
3.State/fee welles) covered by Bond Number(s): 

DATA ENTRY: 

1. Welles) update in the OGIS on: 

2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 

3. Unites) operator number update in OGIS on: 
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: 
5. StatelFee welles) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: 

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION: 

SUR0027842 
N/A 
SUR0027845 
SUR0035619 -FCB 

1122/2016 
1122/2016 
1122/2016 
N/A 
1122/2016 
N/A 

N/A 
6/2/2015 

N/A 

1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division 
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1122/2016 
COMMENTS: 

1/22/2016 

Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
Operator Change/Name Change Worksheet-for State use only

Effective Date: 4/16/2015
FORMER OPERATOR: NEW OPERATOR:
Gasco Prodcution Company N2575 Badlands Production Company N4265
7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500 7979 E. Tufts Avenue, Suite 11500
Denver, CO 80237 Denver, CO 80237
303-996-1805 303-996-1805

CA Number(s): Unit(s):Gate Canyon, Wilkin Ridge Deep, RBU-EOR-GRRV

WELL INFORMATION:
Well Name Sec TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION:
1. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2015
2. Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2015
3. New operator Division of Corporations Business Number: 1454161-0143

REVIEW:
1. Surface Agreement Sundry from NEW operator on Fee Surface wells received on: 6/2/2015
2. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD on: N/A
3. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries: 6/3/2015
4. OPS/SI/TA well(s) reviewed for full cost bonding: 1/20/2016
5. UIC5 on all disposal/injection/storage well(s) approved on: N/A
6. Surface Facility(s) included in operator change: None
7. Inspections of PA state/fee well sites complete on (only upon operators request): N/A

NEW OPERATOR BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: SUROO27842
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: N/A
3.State/fee well(s) covered by Bond Number(s): SUROO27845

SUROO35619-FCB

DATA ENTRY:
1. Well(s) update in the OGIS on: 1/22/2016
2. Entity Number(s) updated in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
3. Unit(s) operator number update in OGIS on: 1/22/2016
4. Surface Facilities update in OGIS on: N/A
5. State/Fee well(s) attached to bond(s) in RBDMS on: 1/22/2016
6. Surface Facilities update in RBDMS on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. The NEW operator of the Fee (Mineral) wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 1/22/2016
COMMENTS:



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

Well Name -
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 

-------
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 
FEDERAL 31-21 G-9-19 
Federal 323-29-9-19 
Federal 421-29-9-19 
Federal 322-29-9-1 9 
Federal 43 1 -29-9-1 9 
Federal 432-29-9-1 9 
Federal 414-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 

.. _--

-----_._- -
federal 321-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 
Federal 212-29-9-19 
State 321-32-9-19 
State 423-32-9-19 
State 421-32-9-19 
State 413-32-9-1 9 
State 323-32-9-1 9 
State 431-32-9-19 ---
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 

-
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-1 0-1 7 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 
GATE CYN ST 23-16-1 1-16 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 

-----
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 
SQUA W CROSSING U 5 
RBU 5-lID -
FEDERAL 7-25A 

Section 
18 
17 
18 
29 
20 
21 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
29 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
32 
36 
36 
36 
30 
29 
23 
26 
19 
17 
21 
32 
20 
17 
19 
32 
4 
32 
29 
16 
16 
29 
8 
16 
20 
20 
4 
22 
24 
2 
11 

------

25 

TWN 'RNG API Number Enti!Y 
090S 190E 4304752496 
090S 190E 4304752522 
090S 190E 4304752538 ' 
090S 190E 4304752544 

. '.' 

090S 190E 4304752545 
090S 190E 4304752546 
090S 190E 4304753026 
090S 190E 4304753027 
090S 190E 4304753029 ; 
090S 190E 4304753030 
090S 190E 4304753031 i 
090S 190E 4304753070 
090S 190E 4304753073 
090S 190E 4304753076 
090S 190E 4304753078 
090S 190E 4304753079 , 
090S 190E 4304753080 
090S 190E 4304753133 1 
090S 190E 4304754479 
090S 190E 4304754480 
090S 190E 4304754481 
090S 190E 4304754482 ! 

090S 190E 4304754483 
090S 190E 4304754529 
090S 180E 4304754541 
090S 180E 4304754542 
090S 180E 4304754543 
090S 190E 4304753012 19650 
100S 170E 4301333098 15941 
090S 190E 4304736915 16556 
090S 180E 4304738573 17201 
090S 190E 4304739777 18344 
O9OS 190E 4304739800 17202 
1I0S 150E 4301332391 13787 
100S 170E 4301332447 14033 
1l0S 150E 4301332475 14417 
100S 170E 4301332560 -14726 
1l0S 160E 4301332611 14439 
100S ,170E 4301332619 15649 
11 OS 170E 4301332674 15537 

' 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 
100S 170E 4301332679 14033 
1I0S 150E 4301332685 16082 
100S 170E 4301332730 15243 
100S 170E 4301332773 15370 
1I0S 170E 4301332778 14802 
1I0S 160E 4301332888 15098 
100S 170E 4301333081 15714 
100S 1 70E '4301333087 i 15807 
11 OS 170E 4301333099 ' 15920 
1I0S 140E 4301333437 16919 
1I0S ,140E 4301333443 16367 
100S 180E 4304730129 16266 
100S ! 180E 4304730409 9005 

I 

090S 180E I4304730624 19030 

Mineral Surface Type Status 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal OW APD 
Federal Federal 'GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 

---
Federal Federal GW APD 
'Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
Federal Federal GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
State State GW APD 
Federal Federal GW DRL 

--

Federal Federal GW OPS 
Fee Fee GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal GW OPS 
Federal Federal ,GW OPS 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
State State GW P ---
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State GW P 
Federal Eederal GW P 

.. -

Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
Federal Federal GW P 
State State 'OW P 
Federal Federal OW P --
Federal Federal OW P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

WellName Section TWN RNGAPINumber Entity Mineral Surface TypeiStatus
FEDERAL 23-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752496 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 14-17G-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304752522 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 13-18G-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304752538 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 23-29G-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304752544 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 24-20G-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304752545 Federal Federal OW APD
FEDERAL 31-21G-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304752546 Federal Federal OW APD
Federal 323-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753026 Federal_ Federal GW APD
Federa1421-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753027 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 322-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753029 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1431-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753030 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 432-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753031 Federal Federal GW APD
Federa1414-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753070 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 412-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753073 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753076 Federal Federal GW APD
federal 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753078 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 213-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753079 Federal Federal GW APD
FEDERAL 321-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753080 Federal Federal GW APD
Federal 212-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304753133 Federal Federal GW APD
State 321-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754479 State State GW APD
State 423-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754480 State State GW APD
State 421-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754481 State State GW APD
State 413-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754482 State State GW APD

te 323-32-9-19 32 0908 190E 4304754483 State State GW APD
State 431-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304754529 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 224-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754541 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 243-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754542 State State GW APD
Desert Spring State 241-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304754543 State State GW APD
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 090S 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 1108 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State_ State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-l l-17 4 110S 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-ll-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 l10S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 l10S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW P
RBU 5-11D 11 l00S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU6-2D 
NGC 33-18J 
RBU 13-2D 

2 
18 
2 

-.-------~--~~----~~--

RBU 16-3D 3 
-----

RBU 1O-1lD 11 
RBU 8-10D 10 
RBU 15-3D 3 
RBU 12-12D 12 
RBU2-10D 10 
RBU 3-15D 15 
RBU 3-12D 12 

--

STATE 7-36A 36 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 
STATE4-32B 32 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 
L YTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 

--

FED 11-21-9-19 21 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 

- -

FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 

----
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 

-~ ~--

DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 

--
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 

- --_._--

DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 

-
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 

100S 180EI4304731190 7075 State State OW P 
090S 190E:4304731200 16155 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180Ei4304731280 16267 State State OW P 

----

100S 180E 14304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 1180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 

-+-- ---- c----
100S 1180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
100S ~~304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180EI4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 14304731801 110784 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW IP 
090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 14304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734169 14140 'Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E !4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734202 113455 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 1190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P 
100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 170EI4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304734607 :13640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E:4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P 

-~ 

090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735405 114928 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW IP 
090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 14304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E!4304735623 i 14640 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P 
090S 190E4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P 
100S 180E'4304735808 !15592 Federal Federal GW P 
100S 190E 4304735844 114356 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P 
090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P 
090S 190E 14304736093 i 14976 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P ---f----

090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P 
090S 180E!4304736220 14763 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P +---
090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P 
090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P 
090S 190E '4304736271 115884 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P 

---
090S 190E !4304736442 .15715 Federal Federal GW P 
090S 180E ;4304736600 ! 14977 Federal Federal GW P 
090S I 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW ,P 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU6i-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State ONV P
14GiC33-18J 18 090S 190E ‡304731200 6155 Federal Federal DNV P
FU3U13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State CA¥ P
RBU 16-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
FU3tJ 10-111) 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal ()VV P
FU3t] 8-10L) 10 100S 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal ()?V JP
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 100S 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU2-10D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federed Federed Cygr p
IUBU3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federed Federed CA¥ P
FU3U3-12D 12 100S 180E 4304733739 14492 Federed Federal OMT P
STATE7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 Sutte Smte GMT P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFLAL23-29#l 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FE]D44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federed (ITV P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FEI342-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GYV P
PETESM'ASH23-12#1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federed Federal GNV P
STATE 4-32B 32 090S 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FEl3 14-18-2 #1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GNV P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Fedenal Federal GB¥ P
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FEI3 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GVV P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW P
FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDEFDAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Fedenal Feden11 GMT P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEE)EFLAL41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Feden11 (39V P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee GW P
LikNIB TItUST24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GMT P
FEEIEftAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E =‡304735808 15592 Federal Federal (39V P
FEDERAL21-6-10-19 6 100S 190E 4304735844 14356 Federed Federed GNV P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STitTE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GVV P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEEIEftAL23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 43047369‡42 15715 Federal Federal (svV P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 
-----

FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 
~HEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 -----_ .. _. __ ._--

FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 

--

----------.. -------

----_. __ . __ ._----_._._._._ .... -

FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 
----------

LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 

125 090S 180E i4304736727 '15475 Federal Federal 
--

30 090S 190E'4304736739 !15476 Federal Federal 
-------
25 090S 180E'4304736740 15213 Federal Federal 
19 090S 190E 14304736771 

-----

15355 Federal Federal 
-- , -

~L ____ f?90S :180EI4304736772 15338 Federal Federal 
f-----'---+---

30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal 
--

22 090S 190E 14304736913 15187 Fee Fee 
- -- ------- - -- ----f-------

LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E:4304736916 : 17012 Fee Fee --_._----

DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180Ei4304737115 115011 State State 
.... __ .. _._---_.--- -_ .. --------

FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 '090S .190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal 

.--------- -- 1--

UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 14304737132 15087 i State State 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E i4304737338 ! 15365 State State 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E :4304737611 116311 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S i 190E!4304737612 16051 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 119OE[4304737613 16052 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S '190E:4304737621 16253 !Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E I4304737622 16264 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E :4304737630 16557 Federal Federal 
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E

'
4304737631 15961 Federal Federal 

~ 

FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 1180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S : 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E !430473767616254 iState State 

----

180E4304737677h5806 State UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S State 
---- c---

UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S ,180E'4304738028 16868 State State 
-- 1-----

FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S ',190E 4304738336 116467 Federal Federal 
1-------

190E 4304738337 116119 IFederal Federal FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S --------------f-----

SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E4304738351 16884 Federal Federal 
--- -

180E~4304738352 ~~ WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 16349 Federal Federal _.-----

SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E [4304738353 16210 Federal Federal 
-

FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S : 190E 4304738407 ; 16236 Federal Federal 
--

SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E!4304738465 16558 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180EI4304738469 16449 Federal Federal 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal 
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S ,190E 4304738673 : 15832 Fee Fee 
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 100S 180E4304738896 16792 Federal Federal 
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E:4304739170 16309 State State 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S : 190EI4304739171 16308 State State 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 1 190E 4304739172 116310 State State 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E!4304739717 17054 Federal Federal 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E,4304739729 17241 Federal Federal -
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 ! 17266 Federal Federal 

. -------. 
4304739773 -: 17013 ,Federal DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E Federal .... -.--_ ..... -

FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E4304740233 17014 Federal Federal 
- - - -

FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E:4304751280 18211 Federal Federal ---------------c------ c---
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190Ei4304751281 18210 Federal Federal 

----f----
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S : 190E 4304752870_1~64? IFederal Federal -------------------r--------- c----

~~~~~~ !;~:~~:~:! ~ 30 090S 190E14304752872 19648 Federal Federal --_ .. __ .. 
30 090S 190E ;4304753011 19649 Federal Federal 

- --1----------
180E 14304753324 '19783 Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S State State 

Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 : 180E 14304753325 36 090S 19783 State State 
--- --

Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S '180E 4304753326 19747 State State 
Desert SI>ring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E '4304753327 119747 State State 

-- _ ... 

DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E :4304753328 119783 State State 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S i 170E 4301332677 ! 15144 State State 
RBU 4-11D III 100S 180E :4304730718 16269 Federal Federal 

GW P 
--

GW P 
-~-. 

GW P 
GW P 
GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
----c------
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

GW IP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,p 

--

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

-------

GW ip 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW ,P 

GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW iP 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW Ip 

GW P 
-----

GW P 
GW P 

----

GW P 
---

OW P 
OW P 
GW P 

--
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 

- --
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW P 
GW :S 
OW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-l l-10-18 11 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State_ GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
RBU4-llD ll 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW



From: Gasco Production Company 
To: Badlands Production Company 
Effective Date: 4/16/2015 

RBU2-llD 
~---- --
RBU 6-llD 
STATE2-32B c--
STATE 9-36A 
FEDERAL 13-30B 
STATE 13-36A 
FEDERAL 16-26A 

II ._-- -------

II 
32 

1

36 
30 

-----~---

36 
126 

------------------+-----

FEDERAL 31-29 129 
RBU I-IOD :10 ----------------------_.- I 

FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 i 18 

100S 180E 4304730826 116270 Federal Federal OW S 
------- ------ 1-------

100S 180E4304731192 16271 .Federal Federal OW S -+---- --
090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 

-090S1180E 4304732225 il1364 
---

State State IGW S 
090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
090S il80E 4304733598 17838 State State IGW S 
090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
090S ! 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
100S 1180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW .S 
090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal iGW S 

From: Gasco Production Company
To: Badlands Production Company
Effective Date: 4/16/2015

RBU 2-l lD 11 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S
RBU 6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S
STATE 2-32B 32 '090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE 9-36A 36 _ _090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW



FORM 9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER: 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significanUy deepen existing wells below current boItom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drlH horizontal laterals. Use APPLlCA TION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for sUCh proposals. 

1. TYPE OF WELL 
OILWELL 0 GAS WELL IlJ OTHER __________ _ 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 

Gasco Production Company 
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: 

7979 E. Tufts Ave. 

4. LOCATIONOFWELL 

CITY Denver 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL 

STATE CO zIP80237 

QTRIOTR, SECTION, TOWJIISHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S 

I PHONE NUMBER: 

(303) 483-0044 

UTU-76482 
6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME: 

7. UMT or CA AGREEMENT NAME: 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER: 

Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18 
9. API NUMBER: 

4304737631 
10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT: 

Uteland Butte 

COUNTY: Uintah 

STATE: 
UTAH 

11. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

rlI 0 ACIDIZE 0 DEEPEN 0 REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

(SubmH in Duplicate) 0 ALTER CASING 0 FRACTURE TREAT 0 SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

Approximate date work wil start: 0 CASING REPAIR 0 NEW CONSTRUCTION 0 TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

4/16/2015 0 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS III OPERATOR CHANGE 0 TUBING REPAIR 

0 CHANGE TUBING 0 PLUG AND ABANDON 0 VENT OR FLARE 

0 SUBSEQUENT REPORT 0 CHANGE WELL NAME 0 PLUG BACK 0 WATER DISPOSAL 
(Submit Original Form Only) 

0 CHANGE WELL STATUS 0 PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) 0 WATER SHUT-OFF 
Date of work completion: 

0 COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS 0 RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 0 OTHER: 

0 CONVERT WELL TYPE 0 RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator 01:1 this well, in addition to the wells on the attached list from Gasco 
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effective date of 4/1612015. 

Gasco Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 11 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

Badlands Production Company 
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui ~ 15 
Denver CO 80237 
303-996-1805 

(512000) 

TITLE 

DATE 

(See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

RECEIVED 
JUN 0 2 2015 

DIV OF OIL, GAS & MINING 

Engineering Tech 

511812015 

APPROVE 
JAN 22 2016 

~.oIL_ GAS & MINING ... 

BY:~Ch.Jt9 rn~cLU'\~ 

STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-76482

6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBE NAME
SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:
Do not use thisform for proposals to drill newwells,significantlydeepen exislingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or to

drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TODRILLform for such proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

OIL WELL O GASWELL OTHER Desert Spring Fed 21-1-10-18
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

Gasco Production Company 4304737631
3 ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

7979 E. Tufts Ave CITY
Denver STATE CO ZIP 80237 (303) 483-0044 Uteland Butte

4 LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 0633 FNL 1512 FWL COUNTY: Uintah

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP. RANGE, MERIDIAN: NENW 1 10S 18E S STATE:
UTAH

19. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submitin Duplicate) ALTER CASING O FR^CTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TOREPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstad CASINGREPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION O TEMPORARILYABANDON

4/16/2015 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE O TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING O PLUGAND ABANDON O VENTOR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME O PLUGBACK O WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOriginalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) O WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE O OTHER:

O CONVERT WELL TYPE O RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearly show allpertinentdetails including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Gasco Production Company requests a change of operator on thiswell, in additionto thewells on the attached list from Gasco
Production Company to Badlands Production Company, effectivedate of 4/16/2015.

Gasco Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Suite 1
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

Michael Decker, Exec. Vi President & COO !)EC61VEL
Badlands Production Company
7979 E Tufts Ave, Sui 15 JUN0 2 205
Denver CO 80237
303-996-1805

DIVOFOiL,GAS&MINING
Michael Decker, Exec. Vic PreWent&COO

NAME (PLEASE PRIN Lindsey Cooke TITLE Engineering Tech

SIGNATURE DATE 5/18/2015

(Thisspacefo Stateuseonly) APPROVED
JAN2 2 2016

(5/2000) (seeinstruolinsonReverseSide) IV.OlL GAS &



Well Name Section TWN RNO API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status 
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal OW DRL 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal OW OPS 
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 O9OS 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee OW OPS 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S lSOE 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal OW OPS 
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal OW OPS 
OATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 II OS 150E 4301332391 13787 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332447 14033 State State OW P 
OATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 II OS 150E 4301332475 14417 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 lOOS 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 II OS 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332619 15649 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 12-4-11-17 4 llOS 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 lOOS 170E 4301332676 15242 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 lOOS l70E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 llOS 150E 4301332685 16082 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 lOOS 170E 4301332730 15243 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 lOOS 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE 32-08 8 llOS l70E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal OW P 
OATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 llOS 160E 4301332888 15098 State State OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 lOOS 170E 4301333087 15S07 Federal Federal OW P 
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 II OS 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 II OS 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal OW P 
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 II OS 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 5-IID II lOOS 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 O9OS 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU6-2D 2 lOOS 180E 430473ll9O 7075 State State OW P 
NOC33-18J 18 O9OS 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 13-20 2 lOOS 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P 
RBU 16-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU IO-IID II lOOS 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU8-IOD 10 l00s 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 15-30 3 lOOS 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU 12-120 12 lOOS lSOE 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU2-IOD 10 lOOS 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-15D 15 lOOS 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P 
RBU3-12D 12 lOOS 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE7-36A 36 O9OS 180E 4304733741 14244 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 34-29 29 090S 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 lOOS 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734ll1 13441 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 24-20-9-19 20 O9OS 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 44-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-29-9-19 29 O9OS 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal OW P 
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 lOOS 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE4-32B 32 O9OS 190E 4304734314 14440 State State OW P 
FED 14-18-2 #1 18 lOOS 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 lOOS l70E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal OW P 
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 22-30-10-18 30 lOOS lSOE 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 11-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal OW P 
FED 42-21-9-19 21 O9OS 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal OW P 
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 090S 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal OW P 

Well Name Section TWN RNG API Entity Mineral Surface Type Status
FEDERAL 332-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753012 19650 Federal Federal GW DRL
WILKINRIDGE FED 43-29-10-17 29 1005 170E 4301333098 15941 Federal Federal GW OPS
LAMB TRUST 11-23-9-19 23 0905 190E 4304736915 16556 Fee Fee GW OPS
SHEEP WASH FED 43-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738573 17201 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 13-19-9-19 19 090S 1908 4304739777 18344 Federal Federal GW OPS
FEDERAL 12-17-9-19 17 090S 190E 4304739800 17202 Federal Federal GW OPS
GATE CYN 31-21-11-15 21 110S 150E 4301332391 13787 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 12-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332447 14033 State State GW P
GATE CYN 41-20-11-15 20 110S 150E 4301332475 14417 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 34-17-10-17 17 100S 170E 4301332560 14726 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN 41-19-11-16 19 110S 160E 4301332611 14439 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 44-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332619 15649 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED l2-4-11-17 4 1108 170E 4301332674 15537 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 24-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332676 15242 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 23-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332679 14033 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-15 16 110S 150E 4301332685 16082 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE ST 34-16-10-17 16 100S 170E 4301332730 15243 State State GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 31-29-10-17 29 100S 170E 4301332773 15370 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE 32-08 8 110S 170E 4301332778 14802 Federal Federal GW P
GATE CYN ST 23-16-11-16 16 110S 160E 4301332888 15098 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 24-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333081 15714 Federal Federal GW P
WILKINRIDGE FED 32-20-10-17 20 100S 170E 4301333087 15807 Federal Federal GW P
WILKIN RIDGE FED 14-4-11-17 4 110S 170E 4301333099 15920 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 22-21 22 110S 140E 4301333437 16919 Federal Federal GW P
RYE PATCH FED 24-21 24 110S 140E 4301333443 16367 Federal Federal GW P
RBU5-llD 11 100S 180E 4304730409 9005 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 7-25A 25 090S 180E 4304730624 9030 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 6-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731190 7075 State State OW P
NGC 33-18J 18 090S 190E 4304731200 6155 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 13-2D 2 100S 180E 4304731280 16267 State State OW P
RBU 16-3D 3 1005 180E 4304731352 16268 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 10-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731357 7053 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 8-10D 10 1005 180E 4304731364 4955 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 15-3D 3 100S 180E 4304731539 9965 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 12-12D 12 1005 180E 4304731651 10688 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 2-l0D 10 100S 180E 4304731801 10784 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-15D 15 100S 180E 4304733600 13213 Federal Federal OW P
RBU 3-12D 12 1005 180E 4304733739 14492 Federal Federal OW P
STATE 7-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733741 14244 State State GW P
FEDERAL 34-29 29 0905 190E 4304733750 13174 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-7 #1 7 100S 180E 4304733983 13182 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-29 #1 29 090S 190E 4304734111 13441 Federal Federal GW P
FED 24-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304734168 14150 Federal Federal GW P
FED 44-20-9-19 20 0908 190E 4304734169 14140 Federal Federal GW P
FED 23-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734199 13601 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304734201 13641 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304734202 13455 Federal Federal GW P
PETES WASH 23-12 #1 12 100S 170E 4304734286 13492 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 4-32B 32 0908 190E 4304734314 14440 State State GW P
FED 14-18-2#1 18 100S 180E 4304734539 13491 Federal Federal GW P
FED 43-24-3 #1 24 100S 170E 4304734551 13726 Federal Federal GW P
LYTHAM FED 22-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304734607 13640 Federal Federal GW P
FED 11-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304734608 14151 Federal Federal GW P
FED 22-30-10-18 30 100S 180E 4304734924 14280 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL43-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304735343 14202 Federal Federal GW P
FED I 1-22-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304735404 14203 Federal Federal GW P
FED 42-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735405 14928 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 24-16-9-19 16 0905 190E 4304735588 14418 State Federal GW



FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 090S 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304735732 14496 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 090S 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee OW P 
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 lOOS 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 lOOS 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 41-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304735845 14639 State State OW P 
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 O9OS 190E 4304735995 14871 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 23-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736219 14738 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 21-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736220 14763 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 12-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736233 14764 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 43-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304736241 14992 State State OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 O9OS 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal OW P 
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 O9OS 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee OW P 
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 O9OS 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee OW P 
DESERT SPRINO ST 33-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304737115 15011 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 O9OS 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737132 15087 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737338 15365 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 O9OS 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal OW P 
DESERT SPRINO FED 21-1-10-18 I l00s 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 I lOOS 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal OW P 
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737676 16254 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304737677 15806 State State OW P 
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 lOOS 180E 4304738028 16868 State State OW P 
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 O9OS 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 O9OS 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal OW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 O9OS 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 O9OS 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal OW P 

FEDERAL 31-21-9-19 21 090S 190E 4304735606 14441 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-29-9-19 29 0908 190E 4304735614 14442 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 24-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735623 14640 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 41-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304735624 14419 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-22-9-19 22 0903 190E 4304735732 144% Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 24-14-9-19 14 0908 190E 4304735733 14519 Fee Fee GW P
FEDERAL 11-22-10-18 22 100S 180E 4304735808 15592 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-6-10-19 6 1005 190E 4304735844 14356 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 41-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304735845 14639 State State GW P
STATE 12-32-9-19 32 090S 190E 4304735995 14871 State State GW P
FEDERAL 12-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736093 14976 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-20-9-19 20 090S 190E 4304736094 16120 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736095 14872 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304736113 15096 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 23-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736219 14738 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 21-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736220 14763 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 12-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736233 14764 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 43-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736241 14992 State State GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 34-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304736242 14716 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736271 15884 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-31-9-19 31 090S 190E 4304736336 15086 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736368 15605 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-31-9-19 31 0908 190E 4304736442 15715 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 43-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736600 14977 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 43-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736719 15186 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 21-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736727 15475 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736739 15476 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304736740 15213 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304736771 15355 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-25-9-18 25 0908 180E 4304736772 15338 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL41-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304736817 15212 Federal Federal GW P
LAMB TRUST 34-22-9-19 22 0905 190E 4304736913 15187 Fee Fee GW P
LAMB TRUST 14-14-9-19 14 0905 190E 4304736916 17012 Fee Fee GW P
DESERT SPRING ST 33-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304737115 15011 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-17-9-19 17 0905 190E 4304737116 16163 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-18-9-19 18 0905 190E 4304737117 16275 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 41-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737132 15087 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 43-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737338 15365 State State GW P
FEDERAL 41-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737611 16311 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 32-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737612 16051 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737613 16052 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 21-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304737621 16253 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 14-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304737622 16264 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304737630 16557 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPRING FED 21-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737631 15961 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-1-10-18 1 100S 180E 4304737646 16023 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 14-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304737647 16121 Federal Federal GW P
UTELAND ST 21-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304737676 16254 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 12-2-10-18 2 1005 180E 4304737677 15806 State State GW P
UTELAND ST 34-2-10-18 2 100S 180E 4304738028 16868 State State GW P
FEDERAL 14-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738336 16467 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 34-19-9-19 19 0905 190E 4304738337 16119 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 41-26-9-18 26 090S 180E 4304738351 16884 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 32-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738352 16349 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 34-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738353 16210 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 12-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304738407 16236 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 23-26-9-18 26 0905 180E 4304738465 16558 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 12-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304738469 16449 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 23-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304738575 16312 Federal Federal GW



LAMB TRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P 
UTELAND FED 42-1 1-10-18 II 100S 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P 
STATE21-32B 32 090S 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P 
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 Slale Stale GW P 
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 Slale State GW P 
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304739717 17054 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P 
SHEEP WASH FED 11-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P 
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P 
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P 
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P 
FEDERAL 423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P 
Desert Springs State 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State Stale GW P 
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 Slate Slale GW P 
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P 
Desert Spring State 142-36-9-18 36 O9OS 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P 
DESERT SPRINGS ST 422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 Slale Stale GW P 
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S 
SQUAW CROSSING U 5 2 100S 180E 4304730129 16266 Slale Slale OW S 
RBU 4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU2-11D II 100S 180E 4304730826 16270 Federal Federal OW S 
RBU6-11D 11 100S 180E 4304731192 16271 Federal Federal OW S 
STATE 2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S 
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 Slale State GW S 
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S 
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S 
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 090S 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S 
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S 
RBU 1-100 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S 
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW S 

LAMBTRUST 34-22A-9-19 22 090S 190E 4304738673 15832 Fee Fee GW P
UTELAND FED 42-11-10-18 11 1005 180E 4304738896 16792 Federal Federal GW P
STATE 21-32B 32 0905 190E 4304739170 16309 State State GW P
STATE 22-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739171 16308 State State GW P
STATE 21-32A 32 090S 190E 4304739172 16310 State State GW P
FEDERAL 11-19-9-19 19 090S 190E 43047397\7 17054 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED 31-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739729 17241 Federal Federal GW P
SHEEP WASH FED I 1-25-9-18 25 090S 180E 4304739730 17266 Federal Federal GW P
DESERT SPG FED 41-1-10-18 I 100S 180E 4304739773 17013 Federal Federal GW P
FED 32-19X-9-19(RIGSKID) 19 090S 190E 4304740233 17014 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL23-30G-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304751280 18211 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 34-19G-9-19 19 090S 190E 4304751281 18210 Federal Federal OW P
FEDERAL 442-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752870 19647 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL 333-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304752872 19648 Federal Federal GW P
FEDERAL423-30-9-19 30 090S 190E 4304753011 19649 Federal Federal GW P
Desert SpringsState 412-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753324 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 424-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753325 19783 State State GW P
Desert Springs State 133-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753326 19747 State State GW P
DesertSpring State 142-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753327 19747 State State GW P
DESERT SPRINGS ST422-36-9-18 36 090S 180E 4304753328 19783 State State GW P
WILKIN RIDGE ST 31-32-10-17 32 100S 170E 4301332677 15144 State State GW S
SQUAW CROSSING US 2 1005 180E 4304730129 16266 State State OW S
RBU4-11D 11 100S 180E 4304730718 16269 Fedem! Fedeml ONV S
RBU2-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304730826 16270 Fedeml Fedeml CAV S
RBU6-IID 11 IDOS 180E 4304731192 16271 Fedem! Fedeml OAV S
STATE2-32B 32 090S 190E 4304732221 11371 State State GW S
STATE9-36A 36 090S 180E 4304732225 11364 State State GW S
FEDERAL 13-30B 30 090S 190E 4304733581 13249 Federal Federal GW S
STATE 13-36A 36 090S 180E 4304733598 17838 State State GW S
FEDERAL 16-26A 26 0905 180E 4304733601 12928 Federal Federal GW S
FEDERAL 31-29 29 090S 190E 4304733653 13077 Federal Federal GW S
RBU 1-10D 10 100S 180E 4304734312 16265 Federal Federal OW S
FEDERAL 13-18-9-19 18 090S 190E 4304739776 17149 Federal Federal GW
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