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Form3160-3 FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) OMB No. 1004-0136

UNITED STATES Expires November30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease SerialNo.

UTU 0807

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER 6. IfIndian, AllotteeorTribeName
UTE TRIBAL

la. Type of Work: DRILL 0 REENTER 7. If Unit or CA Agreement, Name and No.CONFIDENTIAL WONSITSVALLEY

8. Lease Name and Well No.

lb. Type of Well: O Oil Well @ Gas Well O Other SingleZone O Multiple Zone WONSITS VALLEY16W-14-8-21

2. Name of Operator Contact: JOHN BUSCH 9. API Wel o.
SHENANDOAHENERGY INC. E-Mail: jbusch@shenandoahenergy.com gþ

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 E. 17500 S. Ph: 435.781.4341 Fx: 435.781.4323 WONSITS VALLEY
VERNAL,UT 84078

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with any State requirements.*) 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk. and Survey or Area

At surface SESE 684FSL 537FEL Sec 14 T8S R21E Mer SLB
At proposedprod. zone

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. Countyor Parish 13. State
15 MILESSOUTHWEST OF REDWASH UTAH UINTAH UT

15. Distance from proposed location to nearest property or 16. No. of Acres in Lease 17. SpacingUnit dedicatedto this well
lease line, ft. (Also to nearest drig. unit line, if any)

537 1280.00 40.00

18. Distance from proposed location to nearest well, drilling, 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, ft.

1500 7690 MD U-0969
7690 TVD

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KB, RT, GL, etc. 22. Approximate datework will start 23. Estimatedduration
5014 KB 08/24/2001 10 DAYS

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of OnshoreOil and Gas OrderNo. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see
2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).
3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest SystemLands, the 5. Operatorcertification

SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest ServiceOffice). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the
authorized officer.

25. Signature Name (Printedfryped) Date
JOHN BUSCH 08/24/2001

Title
OPERATIONS

A oved b ( i ature Name (Printedfryped) Date

Title Office RECLAMATIONSPECIALIST Ill
Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct
operations thereon.
Conditionsof approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C.Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any personknowinglyand willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitiousor fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Additional Operator Remarks (see next page)

Electronic Submission #6319 verified by the BLM Well Information System
\$ For SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC., sent to the Vernal

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL " ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.
T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. Well location, WV #16W-14-8-21, located os

shown in the SE 1/4 SE 1/4 of Section 14, .

TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M, Uintoh County, Utah.
SB929'05"W - 2658.70' (Meas.) SB928'01"W - 2640.06' (Meas.)

Brass Cop Bross Cap Brass Cap

BASIS OF ELEVATION

BENCH MARK (45 EAM) LOCATED IN THE N 1/2 OF SECTION
5, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROM THE BRENNAN BASIN
QUADRANGLE,UTAH, UINTAH COUNTY 7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES

M DEPARTMENTOF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICAL SURVEY. SAID
e ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 4689 FEET.

Brass Cap gross cap

o - o

SCALE

CERTIFICATE
------ THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE PL g PARED FROM

FIELD NOTES OF ACTUALSURVEYS M R MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT THE SAME TO THE

WV/16W-14-8-21
. 9 BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGEAND B

E7ev. Ungraded Ground = 4910'

IgGISTRATION .¶161319

scoss Cop Brass cap . .

SB9°21'14"W
- 2668.75' (Meas.)

^^ SB9°20'J7"W
- 2672.90' (Meas.) eram co? I,INTAH &GINEERING & YING

85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078
(435) 789-1017

LEGEND: LATITUDE =
40°07'06"

SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:
LONGITUDE=

109°30°48"
1" = 1000' 8-6-01 8-14-01

= 90' SYMBOL
PARTY REFERENCES

= PROPOSED WELL HEAD. BASIS OF BEARINGS IS THE EAST LINE OF THE NE 1/4 0-A. J.A. D.R.B. G.L.O. PLAT
OF SECTION 13, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. WHICH IS ASSUMED WEATHER FILEA = SECTION CORNERS LOCATED FROM G.L.O. INFORMATIONTO BEARNOO'49'W. WARM SHENANDOAH ENERGY,



O O
United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office
P.O. Box 45155

Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3160
(UT-922)

September 5, 2001

Memorandum

To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2001 Plan of Development Wonsits Valley Unit,
Uintah County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Lisha Cordova, Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management. The following wells are planned for calendar year
2001 within the Wonsits Valley Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

Api Number Well Location

(Proposed PZ Wasatch)

43-047-34263 WV 1W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, TSS, R21E 0699 FNL 0615 FEL
43-047-34264 WV 2W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, TSS, R21E 0791 FNL 1996 FEL
43-047-34265 WV 2W-12-8-21 Sec. 12, TSS, R21E 0948 FNL 1818 FEL
43-047-34266 WV 3W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, TSS, R21E 0440 FNL 1946 FWL
43-047-34267 WV 3W-12-8-21 Sec. 12, TSS, R21E 0788 FNL 1941 FWL
43-047-34268 WV 4W-12-8-21 Sec. 12, TSS, R21E 0356 FNL 0475 FWL
43-047-34269 WV 5W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, TSS, R21E 2109 FNL 0676 FWL
43-047-34270 WV 5W-12-8-21 Sec. 12, TSS, R21E 2167 FNL 0586 FWL
43-047-34271 WV 6W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, TSS, R21E 2194 FNL 2012 FWL
43-047-34273 WV 7W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, TSS, R21E 2094 FNL 2092 FEL
43-047-34274 WV 9W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, TSS, R21E 1921 FSL 0758 FEL
43-047-34275 WV 10W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, TSS, R21E 1787 FSL 2028 FEL
43-047-34276 WV 11W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, TSS, R21E 1911 FSL 2075 FWL
43-047-34277 WV 11W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, TSS, R21E 1690 FSL 2145 FWL
43-047-34278 WV 12W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, TSS, R21E 1919 FSL 0917 FWL
43-047-34279 WV 12W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, T8S, R21E 2341 FSL 0841 FWL
43-047-34280 WV 14W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, TSS, R21E 0657 FSL 2058 FWL
43-047-34281 WV 14W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, TSS, R21E 0662 FSL 2002 FWL
43-047-34282 WV 15W-11-8-21 Sec. 11, TSS, R21E 0607 FSL 1933 FEL
43-047-34283 WV 16W-14-8-21 Sec. 14, TSS, R21E 0684 FSL 0537 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the wells at this
time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc: File - Wonsits Valley Unit
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
Agr . Sec .
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Additional Operator Remarks:

Shenandoah Energy Inc. proposes to drill a well to 7690' to test the wasatch. If productive, casing
will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well will be pluggedand abandoned as per BLM and State
of Utah requirements.

Operationwill be according to the StandardOperatingPractices for Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum
Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and undesignated fieldsin T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E.

See OnshoreOrder No. 1 attached.

Please be advised that ShenandoahEnergy Inc. is considered to be the operatorof the above mentioned
well. ShenandoahEnergy Inc. agrees to be responsible under the terms and conditions of the lease for
the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for this well is providedby Bond No. U-0969. The principalis Shenandoah Energy Inc. via
surety as consent as provided for in 43 CFR
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC.
WELL # WV 16W-14-8-21

ONSHORE OlL &GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oiland Gas Leases

AIIlease and/or unit operations willbe conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oiland Gas No. 1, and the approved
plan of operations. The operator is fullyresponsible for the actions of his subcontractors. A copy
of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated tops of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth Prod. Phase Anticipated
Uinta Surface
Green River 2679'
Mahogany Ledge 3439'
Wasatch 5984'
TD (Wasatch) 7690' Gas

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil,Gas, Water and Other MineralBearinq Zones

The estimated depths at which the top and bottom of the anticipated water, oil,gas or other
mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered are as follows:

Substance Formation Depth
Oil/Gas Wasatch 7690'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling, will be
recorded by depth and adequately protected. AIIoil and gas shows will be tested to
determine commercial potential.

Allwater shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal, Utah.
Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If no flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLMalong with any water analyses conducted.

3. Anticipated Bottom Hole Pressures

Maximum anticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 3076.0
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC.
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT#16W-14-8-21

684' FSL 537' FEL SESE
SECTION 14, T8S, R21E, SLB&M

UINTAHCOUNTY, UTAH
LEASE # UTU-0807

ONSHORE ORDER NO. 1

MULTI - POINT SURFACE USE & OPERATIONSPLAN

1. Existing Roads:

Refer to Topo Maps A and B for location of access roads within a 2 - mile radius.

There will be no improvements made to existing access roads.

2. Planned Access Roads:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

Refer to Topo Map B for the location of the proposed access road.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a 1 - Mile Radius:

Please refer to Topo Map C.

4. Location of Existinq & Proposed Facilities:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

Refer to Topo Map D for the location of the proposed pipeline.

5. Location and Type of Water Supply:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

6. Source of Construction Materials:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

7. Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices
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8. Ancillary Facilities:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated fields in T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

9. Well Site Layout: (See Location Layout Diagram)

The attached Location Layout Diagram describes drillpad cross-sections, cuts and fills and locations
of the mud tanks,reserve pit, flare pit, pipe racks, trailerparking, spoil dirt stockpile(s),and surface
material stockpile(s).

Please see the attached diagram to describe rig orientation, parking areas, and access roads.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

Please see the Red Wash, Wonsits Valley, Gypsum Hills, White River, Glen Bench, and
undesignated Meldsin T7S, R21-24E and T8S, R21-24E Standard Operating Practices (SOP).

11. Surface Ownership:

The well pad and access road are located on lands owned by:

Ute Indian Tribe
P.O. Box 143
Ft. Duchesne, UT 84026

12. Other Information

A Class Ill archaeological survey was conducted by Montgomery Archaeology Consultants. A copy
of this report was submitted directly to the appropriate agencies by Montgomery Archaeology
Consultants. Cultural resource clearance was recommended for this
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Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

John Busch
Red Wash Operations Rep.

Shenandoah Energy Inc.
11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4341

Certification:

AIIlease and/or unitoperations willbe conducted in such a manner that full compliance is made
withall applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil &Gas Orders, the approved plan of operations,
and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

Shenandoah Energy Inc. will be fully responsible for the actions of theirsubcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drillwillbe furnished to the field
representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all construction and
drilling operations.

I hereby certifythat 1,or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the proposed drill
site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditionswhich currentlyexist; that the
statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, trueand correct; and that the
work associated with the operations proposed herein willbe performed by Shenandoah Energy
Inc. its' contractors and subcontractors in conformitywith thisplan and the terms and Conditions
under which it is approved. This statement is subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for
the filing of a false statement.

John Busch Date
Red Wash Operations
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC. FICURE #1
LOCATION LAYOUT FOR

WV #16W-14-8-21

Pr**oiling SECTION 14, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.
684 FSL 537' FEL

c's C-2.8' C-0.2' Proposed Access F-5.2'
E/. 909.8' E/. 9072' E/. 901.8'

35

SCALE: 1" = 50'
DATE: 08-15-01 Round Corners
Drawn By D.R.B. os Needed

Approx.
Top of
Cut Slope

Approx.
Toe of
Fill Slope

NO TE:
Flore Pil is to be located PIPE JUSS

a rnin. of 100' from the ! I I I
Well Head

PIPE RACKS

(btrn. pil) 70° | o 35 135'
' Sta. 1+50

TOILET O E-5.8'
E/. 901.2'RESERVE P/TS rm

(8' Deep) TTTTT

UGHT PLANT

PUM HOUSE

RPRES

OR WATER

BOOSTER
' ' Total Pit cquocity

w/r or treasoord -

- = 7,800 Bols. ± -

TRASH Sto. 0+50
rotoi Pit varame

_ :: o
= 2, J40 Cu. Yds.

sviANEE fy

B 35'
" Sta. 0+00

a 972 s' c-7 s' i
C-1J. ' a s;4

(htm. pid .

KS. -
-

, c 4 g' E-4.7
.

..
C-6.6 e gy e. soza
B. 913.6'

NO1ES:
Dev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Sta/<e = 4909.5'

UINTAH ENCINEERINc ac LAND SURVEYING
FINISHED GRADE EZEV AT LOC. STAKE = 490ZO 85 So. 200 Eut • Vemat, Utd 84078 • (435)
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC FICURE //2

TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FORX-Section
scale WV #16W-14-8-21

SECTION 14, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.
1 = 50 684° FSL 537 FEL

Finished Grade

STA J+25

10' 70' 35' 135'

----
-

----

----

.____
_

Location Stake

STA 1+50

10° 70' 35° 135'
Slope = 1 1/2: 1

Preconstruction
35° 135'

Grade

CUTll¯¯lllOll¯lll¯lll¯¯lll¯¯lll="'¯ \
¯¯ ¯

FILL x

STA 0+00

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES E5CECSO AL AFTER
= J,690 Cu. Yds.

CUT Topsoil & Pit Bockfill = 3,690 Cu. Yds.
(12") Topsoil Stripping = 2,520 Cu. Yds- (1/2 Pit Vol.)
Remaining Locotion = 6,7JO Cu. Yds' EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 9,250 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)

FILL = 5,280 CU.YDS, UINTAH ENCINEERINc &· LAND SURVEYINC
85 So. 200 &ast • Vernal, UtaA 84078 * (435)
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1432

7472

SEE TOPO "B"

PROPOSED LOCATION:

OU R WV#16W-14-8-21

TSS
T9S

E E

LEGEND: SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.
PROPOSED LOCATION N WV #16W-14-8-21

SECTION 14, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.
684' FSL 537' FEL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying TOPOGR A PH I C 8 17 01
85 South 2OO East Vernal, Utah 84078 I M A P MONU DAY YBAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813
SCALE:1:1 000 DRAWNBY:KG.REVISED:00-00-00
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15_ 13 13

PROPOSED LOCATION:
WV#16W-14-8-21

TSS
LEGEND: SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.
--------- PROPOSED ACCESSROAD N WV #16W-14-8-21

EXISTING ROAD SECTION 14, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M.

- 2 H
CONFIDENT
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PROPOSED LOCATION: saw L

sTAGEcoAcu ,
-

#10.23
8 CH

TSS
LEGEND: SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.
f DISPOSAL WELLS WATER WELLS N wy #16W-14-8-21
O PRODUClNG WELLS ABANDONED WELLS SECTION 14, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M.

SHUT IN WELLS g TEMPORARILY ABANDONED 684' FSL 53T FEL

E eering & Land Surveying TOPO ÛR A PH I C 8 1 01
85 south 200 East Vernal, Utah Aso78 Af Å Ë B&Y HAR

(435) 789-1017 * FAX (435) 189-1813
SCALE:I"=2000' DRAWNBY:KG. REVISED:



970 W 4 83 21

850

PROPOSED LOCATI N
WV#16W-14-8-21 900

E I TING PIP INE

T8S eso 1
APPROXIMATETOTALPIPELINE DISTANCE = 120' +/-

LEGEND: SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.
------ EXISTING PIPELWE N WV #16w-14-8-21
--------- PROPOSED PIPELINE SECTION 14, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.

PROPOSED ACCESS 684' FSL 537' FEL

- Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying T 0 P 0 GR A PH I C 8 1 01 |85 South 2OO East Vernal, ITtah 84078 AÍ Â f DAY YEAR I
(435) 189-1017 * FAX (435) 789-1813

SCALE:I" = 1000' DILGE BY:K.G. VISED014&00
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SHENANDOAH ENERGY, INC.

WV #16W-14-8-21
LOCATED IN UINTAH COUNTY, UTAH

SECTION 14, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.

PHOTO: VIEW FROM CORNER #1 TO LOCATION STAKE CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHEASTERLY

PHOTO: VIEW FROM BEGINNING OF PROPOSED ACCESS CAMERA ANGLE: NORTHERLY

Uintah Engineering & Land Surveying LOCATIONPHOTOs 8 17 1 mo-ro
85 South 200 East Vernal,Utah 84078 m na van

- sine,i 4. 435-789-1017 uels@uelsinc.com TAKENBYDA DRAWNBYKG. REVISED00-00-00



WORKSHEET
APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 08/29/2001 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-34283

WELL NAME: WV 16W-14-8-21

OPERATOR: SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC ( N4235 )

CONTACT: JOHN BUSCH PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4341

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /
SESE 14 080S 210E

SURFACE: 0684 FSL 0537 FEL Tech Review Initials Date

BOTTOM: 0684 FSL 0537 FEL Engineering
UINTAH

WONSITS VALLEY ( 710 ) Geology

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal Surface

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-0807

SURFACE OWNER: 2 - Indian

PROPOSED FORMATION: WSTC

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

\/ /Plat R649-2-3. Unit WONSITS VALLEY

Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[] R649-3-2. General
CNo.U-0969 ) Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920'Between Wells

Potash (Y/N) R649-3-3. Exception
,Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 /*

Water Permit Drilling Unit

UNo.43-8496 ) Board Cause No: g)L¢

RDCC Review (Y/N)
Eff Date: ,)

(Date: )
Siting: i

. ÛhÄË6/La é

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS: ÑV FR Snó mgah &.
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TR)RKSHEET

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL

APD RECEIVED: 08/29/2001 API NO. ASSIGNED: 43-047-34283

WELL NAME: WV 16G-14-8-21

OPERATOR: QUESTAR EXPLORATION & ( N5085 ) PHONE NUMBER: 435-781-4341

CONTACT: JOHN BUSCH

PROPOSED LOCATION: INSPECT LOCATN BY: / /

SESE 14 080S 210E .Tech Review Initials Date
SURFACE: 0684 FSL 0537 FEL

BOTTOM: 0684 FSL 0537 FEL Engineering

COUNTY: UINTAH
Geology

LATITUDE: 40.11820 LONGITUDE: -109.5134

UTM SURF EASTINGS:626680 NORTHINGS: 4441725 Surface

FIELD NAME: WONSITS VALLEY ( 710 )

LEASE TYPE: 1 - Federal

LEASE NUMBER: UTU-0807 PROPOSED FORMATION: WSTC
SURFACE OWNER: 2 - Indian COALBED METHANE WELL? NO

RECEIVED AND/OR REVIEWED: LOCATION AND SITING:

v/ Plat R649-2-3.

Bond: Fed[1] Ind[] Sta[] Fee[]
Unit: WONSITS VALLEY

(No. ESBOOOO24 )
Potash (Y/N) R649-3-2. General

Oil Shale 190-5 (B) or 190-3 or 190-13 Siting:460 From Qtr/Qtr & 920' Between Wells

Water Permit R649-3-3. Exception
(No. 43-8496 ) //

Drilling Unit
RDCC Review (Y/N)

Board Cause No: |ff-ð(Date:
Eff Date: g-ggec/

Fee Surf Agreement (Y/N) Siting: , Ud '

Intent to Commingle (Y/N) R649-3-11. Directional Drill

COMMENTS:
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OPERATOR: SHENANDOAHENERGY (N4235)

SEC. 11,12 & 14, TSS, R21E

FIELD:WONSITSVALLEY(710)

COUNTY:UINTAH UNIT: WONSITS VALLEY
Utah OilGas and Mining CAUSE: 187-06

T8S R21E
WV 3W-11-8-21 WV4W-12·8,21 WVU27 WVU8

WVFU 4W-11-8-21 WVU3D

WVFU4G-11421 WV 1W 1-6-21 WV3W-12421
WV 2 12-8-21

WWFU1W-12-421

WONSITS VALLEYFIELD
WVFUSW-11-8-21

WVUig WVUB6 WVUS1 WVUB5
e WVFUBW-11-8-21 +

WVUM WVU137 39 WVFut1WG *

WVU95 WV6W-t28-21 WV6W-12-&21 WVPUSW-12421
WV BW-11-821 WV M-11-8 21

12
11

W WVFUTT 2+21

WWFU 12+M

WVFU9W 21

wv,2w, 42, wvro w.ss.2'
""""*" WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

CAUSE 187-06 (8-2-2001)
WVFU13W-11-8-21

.WVU17 WVU92 WVU14 WVU108 4

wvuse avu42 wvues e g
• uveu saw.92.. WVFU14W-12-6-21 WVFU 16W-12 8-21

WVU 43 WV 14W-91-&21
WV 15W-11-8-21 WV 16W-11-8-21

WVU116 VU 135. - - - -

¯

WVFU3W-14+21 WVU101

wvu9ca -

WVU103 A WVU44 WVU101-2 g WVFUSW t 4 21 WVu 100 WWFU1W 11 21
WVU31 WV2W-14421 4 WV4W-13*21

WVFU †W-14+ 21
WV4W-14&à1

WVFUSW-14-8-21 WVFUBW-14-6-21 WVFUSW-18-8-21 WVU106 WVU45 WVU118

a **. WVU47 WVFU6 -13-521 WVFU7W 21
WVUSB WVU111 WVFUBW-1&&21

WV SW-14 8·21 WVFU 7W 14·8-21

WV 12W-14-8-21 14

• ®
WVU 121

WVu 107 WVFu t1W-la-t-24 WVU 13 wvsu ow-lae21

WV1 -1421
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PREPARED BY: LCORDOVA
DATE:
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WONSITS VALLEY FIELD
WONSITS VALLEY UNIT
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OPERATOR: QUESTAR EXPL & PROD (N5085)
UT AH

SEC: 14 T.8S R. 21E DNR
FIELD: WONSITSVALLEY (710)

COUNTY: UINTAH
Wells Status

CAUSE: 187-06 / 8-2-2001 y GAS INJECTION
o GAS STORAGE OIL GAS & MINING
x LOCATION ABANDONED
e NEW LOCATION

Field Status Unit Status * PLUGGED & ABANDONED
ABANDONED

(¯]EXPLORATORY a- PRODUCING GAS
ACTIVE S LRAGE é OD IN OIL
COMBINED NF SECONDARY

+ SHUT-IN OIL W E
INACFIVE NDING

)s( TEMP. ABANDONED
PROPOSED

PP GAS o TEST WELL
STORAGE PP GEOTHERML & WATER INJECTION STERMINATED PP OIL g WATER SUPPLY PREPAREDBY:DIANA MASON

SECONDARY WATER DISPOSAL DATE:16-NOVEMBER-2007
TERMINATED



state*ofUtah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GASAND MINING
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210

Michael O. Leavitt PO Box 145801Governor
Kathleen Clarke Salt Lake City,Utah 84114-5801

Executive Director 801-538-5340

Lowell P. Braxton 801-359-3940 (Fax)
Division Director 801-538-7223 (TDD)

September 5, 2001

Shenandoah Energy Inc.
11002 East 17500 South
Vernal, UT 84078

Re: Wonsits Valley 16W-14-8-21 Well, 684' FSL, 537' FEL, SE SE, Sec. 14, T. 8 South,
R. 21 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-34283.

Sincerely,

ohn R. Baza
Associate Director "

dm
Enclosures
cc: Uintah County Assessor

Bureau of Land Management, Vernal District



O O
Operator: Shenandoah Energy Inc.

Well Name & Number Wonsits Valley 16W-14-8-21

API Number: 43-047-34283
Lease: UTU 0807

Location: SE SE Sec. 14 T. 8 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284.

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dan Jarvis at (801) 538-5338

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to



Form 3160-3 FORM APPROVED

(August 1999)
OMB No. 10044136

UNITED STATES Expires November 30, 2000

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. Lease Serial No.

UTU0807

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL OR REENTER 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name
UTETRIBAL

la. Type of Work: DRILL 0 REENTER CONFIDENTIAL ' 5°o"hävCA AAgreeLmEent,Name and No.

8. Lease Name and Well No.

lb. Type of Well: O Oil Well Gas Well O Other E Single Zone O Multiple Zone WONSITSVALLEY16W-14-8-21

2. Name of Operator Contact: JOHN BUSCH 9. API Well No.

SHENANDOAHENERGYINC. E-Mail: jbusch@shenandoahenergy.com

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

11002 E. 17500 S. Ph: 435.781.4341 Fx: 435.781.4323 WONSITSVALLEY
VERNAL,UT 84078

4. location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance wit iggg 11. Sec., T., R., M., or Blk. and Survey or Area

At surface SESE 684FSL 537FEL Sec 14 T8S R21E Mer SLB
SEP 12 2001

At proposed prod. zone

14. Distance in miles and direction from nearest town or post office* 12. County or Parish 13. State

15 MILESSOUTHWEST OF REDWASH UTAH UINTAH UT

15. Distance from proposed location to nearest property or 16. No. of Acres in Lease 17. Spacing Unit dedicated to this well

lease line, ft. (Also to nearest drig. unit line, if any)
537 1280.00 40.00

18. Distance from proposed location to nearest well, drilling, 19. Proposed Depth 20. BLM/BIA Bond No. on file
completed, applied for, on this lease, ft.

1500 7690 MD U-0969
7690TVD

21. Elevations (Show whether DF, KB, RT, GL, etc. 22. Approximate date work will start 23. Estimated duration

5014 KB 08/24/2001 10 DAYS

24. Attachments

The following, completed in accordance with the requirements of Onshore Oil and Gas Order No. 1, shall be attached to this form:

1. Well plat certified by a registered surveyor. 4. Bond to cover the operations unless covered by an existing bond on file (see

2. A Drilling Plan. Item 20 above).

3. A Surface Use Plan (if the location is on National Forest System Lands, the 5. Operator certification
SUPO shall be filed with the appropriate Forest Service Office). 6. Such other site specific information and/or plans as may be required by the

authorized officer.

25. Signature Name (Printed/Typed) Date
JOHN BUSCH 08/24/2001

Title

MineralResources
Application approval does not warrant or certify the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct

operations thereon.
Conditions of approval, if any, are attached.

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

Additional Operator Remarks (see next page) NOTICEOFAPPROVAL
Electronic Submission #6319 verified by the BLMWell Information System

For SHENANDOAHENERGY INC.,sent to the Vernal
Committed to AFMSSfor processing by LESLIE CRINKLAWon 09/12/2001 ()

CONDITIONSOFAPPROVALATTACHED
** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



O O
COAs Page 1 of _4

Well No.: WVFU#16W-14-8-21

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL
APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILL

Company/Operator: Shenandoah Enerqy Inc.

Well Name & Number: WVFU #16W-14-8-21

API Number: 43-047-34283

Lease Number: U - 0807

Location: SESE Sec. _1_4_ T.1LS_R. 21E

Agreement: WONSITSVALLEYFEDERAL UNIT

For morespecificdetails on notificationrequirements, please checkthe Conditions ofApproval

for Notice to Drilland Surface Use



O
COAs Page 2 of 4

Well No.: WVFU#16W-14-8-21

CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL FOR NOTICETO DRILL

Approval of this applicationdoes not warrant or certifythat the applicantholds legal or equitable

titleto those rights in the subject lease which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations

thereon.

Be aware fire restrictions may be in effect when location is being constructed and/orwhen well

is being drilled. Contact the appropriateSurface Management Agency for information.

A. DRILLINGPROGRAM

1. Casinq Program and AuxiliaryEquipment

As a minimum,the usable waterand oilshale resources shall be isolated and/or
protected by having a cement top for the production casing at least 200 ft. above the
base ofthe usable water zone, identifiedat ± 860



O O
COAs Page 3 of _4

Well No.: WVFU#16W-14-8-21

SURFACE USE PROGRAM
CONDITIONSOF APPROVAL(COAs)

Shenandoah Energy, INC.(Shenandoah) willassure the Ute Tribe that anylall contractorsand

subcontractors have acquireda current Tribal Business License and have updated "Access

Permits" prior to construction. AllShenandoah personnel, contractorsand subcontractorswill

have these permits in theirvehicles at alltimes. Companies that have not compliedwith this

COAwillbe in violationof the Ute Tribal Business License Ordinance, and willbe subjectto
fines and penalties.

Shenandoah employees,representatives,and/orauthorizedpersonnel (subcontractors)shall

notcarryfirearms on theirperson or in theirvehicles whileworkingon the Uintah and Ouray

Indian Reservation.

Shenandoah employeesand/or authorizedpersonnel (subcontractors)in the fieldwillhave

approvedapplicable APDs and/or ROW permits/authorizations on theirperson(s) during all
phases ofconstruction.

Shenandoah willnotifythe Ute Tribe and Bureau of Indian Affairs (BIA) in writingof any

requested modificationof APDs or Rights-OfWay (ROW). Shenandoah shall receivewritten

notificationof authorizationor denial ofthe requested modification. Withoutauthorization,
Shenandoah willbe subject to fines and penalties.

The Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Department shallbe notifiedin writing48 hours in advance of

any construction activity.The Ute Tribal officeis open Monday throughThursday. A Tribal

Technician is to routinelymonitorconstruction.Shenandoah shall make arrangementswith the

Ute Energy & Minerals Department for allmonitoringthat willexceed regular workinghours for

TribalTechnicians. AqualifiedArchaeologist accompaniedby a Tribal Technician will

monitoranytrenching constructionofthe pipeline. Shenandoah is to informcontractorsto
maintain construction of the pipelines withinthe approved right ofways.

Shenandoah shall maintain cattleguards and fence integrity as originallyconstructedfor any
access roads or pipeline routes which cross the Ute Indian Reservation Boundary Fence.

A corridorROW, 30 feet wide and 120 feet long, shallbe granted for the pipeline and new
access road. The constructed travelwidth of the access road willbe limited to 18 feet. Upon

authorizationby the Ute Tribe Energy & Minerals Department, the ROW maybe wider where

sharp curves; deep cuts and fillsoccur;or,where intersections withother roads are required.

Upon completionofthe pertinent APD and ROWs, Shenandoah willnotifythe Ute Tribe Energy

& Minerals Department for a TribalTechnician to verifythe Affidavitof Completion. When each

pipeline has been constructed and completedas builtdescriptions willbe filed with the Ute

Tribal Energy and Minerals



COAs Page 4 of _4

Well No.: WVFU#16W-14-8-21

Production waters, oil,and other byproducts shallnotbe placed on access roads or the well

pad.

Allvehicular traffic,personnel movement, constructionand restoration operations willbe

confined to the areas examined and approved and to the existing roadways and/or evaluated

access routes.

Shenandoah willimplement "Safety and Emergency Plan" and ensure plan compliance.

Shenandoah shall stop constructionactivities and notifypersonnel from the Ute Tribe Energy &

Minerals Department and BIAifculturalremains includingpaleontologic resources (vertebrate

fossils) are exposed or identifiedduring construction. The Ute Tribe Department of Cultural

Rights and Protection and the BIAwillprovide mitigationmeasures prior to allowing
construction.

Shenandoah employeesand/orauthorizedpersonnel (subcontractors)willnot be allowedto

collect artifactsand paleontologic fossils. No significantculturalresources shall be disturbed.

Shenandoah willcontrol noxious weeds on the wellsite and ROWs. Shenandoah wiffbe

responsible for noxious weed control ifweeds spread from the projectarea ontoadjoiningland.

Reserve pits willbe tested for leakage prior to use. Ifsufficientclayis present in the soils the

liner willbe waived for this pit. Ifsufficientclay is not present then the pit willbe lined with an

impervious syntheticliner to conserve fluids. A fence willbe constructedaround the reserve

pit until it is backfilled. Prior to backfillingthe reserve pit, all fluids willbe pumped from the pit

into trucksand hauled to approved disposal sites. When the reserve pits are backfilled,the
surplus oiland mud, etc., willbe buried a minimumof3 feet below the surface of the soil.

A closed system willbe used during production. This means that production fluidswillbe

containedin leak-proof tanks. Allproduction fluidswillbe disposed of at approveddisposal

sites.

Surface pipelines willbe constructed to lay on the soilsurface. The ROWwillnot be bladed or

cleared of vegetation without authorization of the BIA. Surface pipelines shallbe welded in

place at well sites or on access roads then pulled into place withsuitableequipment. Vehicles

shall not use pipeline ROWs as access roads unless specificallyauthorized.

Before the site is abandoned, Shenandoah willbe required to restore the well site and ROWs to
near theiroriginalstate. The disturbed areas willbe reseeded withdesirable perennial

vegetation.

Soil erosion willbe mitigated by reseeding alldisturbed



F6rm 3160-5
(August 1999) ITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPA NT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000
5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU 0807
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. IUfIndian lottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 7. If Unit or CA/Agreement, Name and/or No.
WONSITS VALLEY

l. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No.

O Dil Well ŒlGas Well O Other WV 16W 14 8 21

2. Name of Operator Contact: DAHN CALDWELL 9. API wellNo.
SHENANDOAH ENERGY E-Mail: dcaldwell@shenandoahenergy.com 43-047-34283

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. finclude area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 E. 17500 S. Ph: 435.781.4342 WONSITS VALLEY
VERNAL, UT 84078 Fx: 435.828.5044

4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 14 T8S R21E SESE 684FSL 537FEL UINTAHCOUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent
Acidize O Deer O Prodnetion (Start/Resume) O Water Rhnt-Off

Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity
Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete B Other

0 Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon Well Spud

O Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.
If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

This well was spud on 3/01/02. Drilled 12 1/4" hole to 471'KB. Ran 10 Jts 9 5/8", 36#, J-55 to
460'KB.

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #10649 verifle by the BLM Well Information System

For SHENANDOAH EN GY, sent to the Vernal

Titlee AUT5HORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Ap rove_By
_ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United
States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

" ORIGINAL " ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL" ORIGINAL** ORIGINAL**



State of Utah OPERATOR ACCT. No. N4235
Division of Oil, Gas and Mining OPERATOR: Shenandoah Energy, Inc.

ADDRESS: 11002 East 17500 South
ENTITY ACTION FORM - FORM 6 Vernal, Utah 84078-8526 (801)781-4300

Action Current New Entity API Number Well Name QQ SC TP RG County Spud Date Effective Date

Code Entity No.
No.

B 43-047-34283 WV 16W 14 8 21 SE SE 14 8S 21E Uintah 3/01/02

WELL 1 COMMENTS:
New well to be drilled in Wonsits Valley.

LL 2 COMMENTS:

I IIII I
WELL 3 COMMENTS:

/

WELL4 COMMENTS:

I I I I I
WELL 5 COMMENTS:

ACTION CODES (See instructions on back of form)
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well only) /

B - Add new wellto existing entity (groupor unit well)
C - Re-assign well from one existingentity to another existing entity Signature
D - Re-assign well from one existing entity to a new entity
E - Other (explain in comments section) Administrative Assistant 03/05/02

Title Date

NOTE: Use COMMENT section to explain why each Action Code was selected
Phone No. (435)781-4342

(3/89)



3st 09
9) ITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30. 2000
5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU 0807
Do not use this form for proposals to dri/I or to re-enter an

abandoned we/I. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. If InEdian lottee or Tribe Name

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE - Other instructions on reverse side. 89U1mt08r4C CAgreement,Name and/or No.

1. Type of Well * * | I 8. Well Name and No.
Oil Well O Gas Well O Other WV 16W 14 8 21

2. NameofOperator Contact: ANN PETRIK 9. APIWellNo.
SHENANDOAHENERGY INC. E-Mail: apetrik@shenandoahenergy.com 43-047-34283

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH Ph: 435.781.4306 WONSITS VALLEY
VERNAL, UT 84078 Fx: 435.781.4329

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T., R., M., or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 14 T8S R21E SESE 684FSL 537FEL UINTAHCOUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off

O Alter casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation 0 Well Integrity
Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete B Other

0 Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon Production Start-up

0 Convert to Injection O Plug Back O Water Disposal
13. DescribeProposed or Completed Operation(clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.

If the proposal is to deepen directionallyor recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locationsand measured and true vertical depths of all pertinent markers and zones.
Attach the Bondunder which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days
followingcompletion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filedonce
testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

COMPLETED AS A GREEN RIVER FORMATION OIL WELL. FIRST PRODUCTION DATE 05/04/02.

REGElvEu
MAY? 0 2002
DIVISION OF

OIL,GAS AND WNING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #11344 verified by the BLM Well Information System

For SHENANDOAH ENERE-YINC., sent to the Vernal

Name d/TypeMNN PETRIK Title ADMINISTRATIVE CONTACT

Si nature (Electronic Submission) Date 05/16/2002

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

Apgoved By Title Date

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office
Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

Statesany false, fictitious or fraudulentstatements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL **



9 0
Form 3160-5
(August 1999) UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
OMB NO. 1004-0135

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT
Expires: November 30, 2000

5. Lease Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTUO807
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to re-enter an

abandoned well. Use form 3160-3 (APD) for such proposals. 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

SUBMITIN TRIPLICATE- Other instructions on reverse side. I UTUni o3r0C4Agreement, Name and/or No.

l. Type of Well 8. Well Name and No,

O Oil Well @ Gas Well O Other
WVFU 16W-14-8-21

2. Name of Operator Contact: ANN PETRIK 9. API Well No.

SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC E-Mail: apetrik@shenandoahenergy.com 43-047-34283-00-X1

3a. Address 3b. Phone No. (include area code) 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory

11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH Ph: 435.781.4306 WONSITS VALLEY
VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 Fx: 435.781.4329

4. Location of Well (Footage, Sec., T, R., M, or Survey Description) 11. County or Parish, and State

Sec 14 T8S R21E SESE 684FSL 537FEL UINTAHCOUNTY, UT

12. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX(ES) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent O Acidize O Deepen O Production (Start/Resume) O Water Shut-Off

0 Alter Casing O Fracture Treat O Reclamation O Well Integrity

B Subsequent Report O Casing Repair O New Construction O Recomplete Other

O Final Abandonment Notice O Change Plans O Plug and Abandon O Temporarily Abandon
Production Start-up

0 Convert to Injection 0 Plug Back O Water Disposal

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operation (clearly state all pertinent details, including estimated starting date of any proposed work and approximate duration thereof.

If the proposal is to deepen directionally or recomplete horizontally, give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths ofall pertinent markers and zones.

Attach the Bond under which the work will be performed or provide the Bond No. on file with BLM/BIA. Required subsequent reports shall be filed within 30 days

following completion of the involved operations. If the operation results in a multiple completion or recompletion in a new interval, a Form 3160-4 shall be filed once

testing has been completed. Final Abandonment Notices shall be filed only after all requirements, including reclamation, have been completed, and the operator has
determined that the site is ready for final inspection.)

COMPLETEDAS A GREEN RIVERFORMATIONOILWELL. FIRST PRODUCTION DATE 05/04/02.

RECEIVED
JUN112002
DIVISIONOF

OIL, GAS AND MINING

14. I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and correct.
Electronic Submission #11344 verifie by the BLMWell Information System

For SHENANDOAH ENER :Y INC, sent to the Vernal
Committed to AFMSS for processing by LE -LIEWALKER on 06/04/2002 (02LW1050SE)

Name(Printed/Typed) ANN PETRIK Title ADMINISTRATIVECONTACT

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 05/16/2002

THIS SPACE FOR FEDERAL OR STATE OFFICE USE

KIRKFLEETWOODACCEPTED T¡tie PETROLEUMENGINEER Date 06/11/2002
Approved By_ - - - --

Conditions of approval, if any, are attached. Approval of this notice does not warrant or
certify that the applicant holds legal or equitable title to those rights in the subject lease
which would entitle the applicant to conduct operations thereon. Office Vernal

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency of the United

States any false, fictitious or fraudulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** REVISED ** REVISED ** REVISED " REVISED ** REVISED ** REVISED ** REVISED ** REVISED



O O
Revisions to Operator-Submitted EC Data for Sundry Notice #11344

Operator Submitted BLM Revised (AFMSS)

Sundry Type: STARTUP STARTUP
SR SR

Lease: UTUO807 UTUO807

Agreement: 891008482C UTU63043C

Operator: SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC. SHENANDOAHENERGY INC
11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH
VERNAL,UT 84078 VERNAL,UT 84078-8526
Ph: 435.828.3040 Ph: 435.781.4300
Fx: 435.828.8731 Fx: 435.781.4329

Admin Contact: ANN PETRIK ANN PETRIK
ADMINISTRATIVECONTACT ADMINISTRATIVE CONTACT
E-Mail: apetrik@shenandoahenergy.com E-Mail: apetrik@shenandoahenergy.com

Ph: 435.781.4306 Ph: 435.781.4306
Fx: 435.781.4329 Fx: 435.781.4329

Tech Contact:

Location:
State: UT UT
County: UINTAH UINTAH

Field/Pool: WONSITS VALLEY WONSITS VALLEY

Well/Facility: WV 16W 14 8 21 WVFU 16W-14-8-21
Sec 14 T8S R21E SESE 684FSL 537FEL Sec 14 T8S R21E SESE 684FSL



Form 3160-4 UNITED STATES FORM APPROVED
(August 1999) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR OMB No. 1004-0137

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Expires: November 30, 2000

WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG 5. LeaseSerialNo.
UTU-0807

la. Type of Well Oil Well O Gas Well O Dry O Other 6. If Indian, Allottee or Tribe Name

b. Type of Completion New Well O Work Over O Deepen O Plug Back O Diff. Resvr.

Oth 7. Unit or CA Agreement Name and No.er 8910084820
2. Name of Operator Contact: J.T. CONLEY 8. Lease Name and Well No.

SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC E-Mail: jconley@shenandoahenergy.com WV 16W-14-8-21
3. Address 11002 EAST 17500 SOUTH 3a. Phone No. (include area code) 9. API Well No.

VERNAL, UT 84078 Ph: 435.781.4300 43-047-34283

4. Location of Well (Report location clearly and in accordance with Federal requirements)* 10. Field and Pool, or Exploratory
WONSITS VALLEY

At surface SESE 684FSL 537FEL

l
11. Sec., T., R., M., or Block and Survey

At top prod interval reported below SESE 684FSL 537FEL or Area Sec 14 T8S R21E Mer SLB

12. County or Parish 13. State
At total depth SESE 684FSL 537FEL UINTAH UT

14. Date Spudded 15. Date T.D. Reached 16. Date Completed 17. Elevations (DF, KB, RT, GL)*
03/01/2002 03/14/2002 OD & A Ready to Prod. 4907 GL

05/03/2002
18. Total Depth: MD 7700 19. Plug Back T.D.: MD 6238 20. Dei.th Bridge Plug Set: MD

TVD TVD TVD

21 e Electric & Other nical Logs Run (Sgþmit copy of each) - ff-eg 22. Was well cored? No O Yes (Submit analysis)
SPECTRAL DENSI IRES INDUCTION,CBL-VDL Was DST run? No O Yes (Submit analysis)

Directional Survey? No O Yes (Submit analysis)

23. Casing and Liner Record (Report all strings set in well)

Top Bottom Stage Cementer No. of Sks. & Slurry Vol.
Hole Size Size/Grade Wt. (#/ft.) Cement Top* Amount Pulled

(MD) (MD) Depth Type of Cement (BBL)

12.250 9.625 K-55 36.0 0 460 175 0
7.875 5.500 J-55 15.5 0 6333 980 600

24. Tubing Record

Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD) Size Depth Set (MD) Packer Depth (MD)

2.875| 5390|
25. Producing Intervals 26. Perforation Record

Formation Top Bottom Perforated Interval Size No. Holes Perf. Status

A) GREEN RIVER 5227 5232 5227 TO 5232 OPEN
B)

C)

27. Acid, Fracture, Treatment, Cement Squeeze, Etc.

Depth Interval Amount and Type of Material
5150 TO 5370 SQUEEZE PERFS WITH 175 SXS, RE-SQUEEZE WITH 225 SXS JUL29 2002

DIVISION UI-
28. Production - Interval A OIL, OA3 AND MINING

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

05/04/2002 05/15/2002 24 22.0 0.0 321.0 GAS PUMPING UNIT
Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. 25 Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI 25.0 POW
28a. Production - Interval B

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

(See Instructions and spaces for additional data on reverse side)
ELECTRONIC SUBMISSION #13134 VERIFIED BY THE BLM WELL INFORMATION SYSTEM

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



0 0
28b. Production - Interval C

Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr.API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

28c. Production - Interval D
Date First Test Hours Test Oil Gas Water Oil Gravity Gas Production Method
Produced Date Tested Production BBL MCF BBL Corr. API Gravity

Choke Tbg. Press. Csg. 24 Hr. Oil Gas Water Gas:Oil Well Status
Size Flwg. Press. Rate BBL MCF BBL Ratio

SI

29. Disposition of Gas(Sold, used forfuel,vented, etc.)
SOLD

30. Summary of Porous Zones (Include Aquifers): 31. Formation (Log) Markers

Show all important zones of porosity and contents thereof: Cored intervals and all drill-stem
tests, including depth interval tested, cushion used, time tool open, flowing and shut-in pressures
and recoveries.

Top
Formation Top Bottom Descriptions, Contents, etc. Name

Meas. Depth

GREEN RIVER 5227 5232 GREEN RIVER 2681

CONFŒNTIAI.

32. Additional remarks (include plugging procedure):
CONFIDENTIAL- TITE HOLE
Do not release well information without permission from Shenandoah Energy inc.

33. Circle enclosed attachments:
1. Electrical/Mechanical Logs (1 full set req'd.) 2. Geologic Report 3. DST Report 4. Directional Survey
5. Sundry Notice for plugging and cement verification 6. Core Analysis 7 Other:

34. I hereby certify that the foregoing and attached information is complete and correct as determined from all available records (see attached instructions):

Electronic Submission #13134 Verified by the BLM Well Information System.
For SHENANDOAH ENERGY INC, sent to the Vernal

Name(pleaseprint) J.T. CONLEY Title DIVISIONMANAGER

Signature (Electronic Submission) Date 07/26/2002

Title 18 U.S.C. Section 1001 and Title 43 U.S.C. Section 1212, make it a crime for any person knowingly and willfully to make to any department or agency
of the United States any false, fictitious or fradulent statements or representations as to any matter within its jurisdiction.

** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL ** ORIGINAL



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING ^

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH

2. CDW
3. FILE

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent/Operator

X Operator Name Change Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 2/1/2003
FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N4235-ShenandoahEnergy Inc N2460-QEP Uinta Basin Inc

11002E 17500S 11002E 17500S
Vernal, UT 84078-8526 Vernal, UT 84078-8526

Phone: (435) 78 1-4341 Phone: (435) 781-4341

CA No. Unit: WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

WELL(S)
NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE WELL WELL "

NO TYPE TYPE STATUS

WV 9W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734274 Federal GW APD C
WV 11W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734276 Federal GW APD C
WV 12W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734278 Federal GW APD C
WV 14W-1l-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734280 Federal GW APD C
WV 15W-l l-8-21 ll 080S 210E 4304734282 Federal GW APD C
WV 5W-12-8-2l 12 080S 210E 4304734270 12436 Federal GW DRL C
WV 6W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734271 12436 Federal GW P
WV 10W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734275 12436 Federal GW P
WV ll W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734277 12436 Federal GW P
WV 12W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734279 12436 Federal GW P
WV 14W-14-8-2l 14 080S 210E 4304734281 12436 Federal GW P
WV 16W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734283 5265 Federal OW P
WV 3W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734289 Federal GW APD C
WV 4W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734291 Federal GW APD C
WV 5W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734293 Federal GW APD C
WV 6W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734294 12436 Federal GW P
WV 10W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734295 12436 Federal GW P
WV lW-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734288 State GW APD C
WV 3W-l6-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734290 State GW APD C
WV 4W-16-8-2l 16 080S 210E 4304734292 State GW APD C

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/2/2003

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/2/2003

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/19/2003

4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Number: 5292864-0151

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on:

QEP UB 50 FORM



O O
6. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE

7. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 7/21/2003

8. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 7/21/2003

9. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: n/a

10. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: n/a

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 9/16/2003

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 9/16/2003

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: n/a

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: n/a

STATE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965-003-032

FEDERAL WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24

INDIAN WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446

FEE WELL(S) BOND VERIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965-003-033

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
The Division sent response by letter on: n/a

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
3. (R649-2-l0) The FORMER operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS:

QEP UB 50 FORM



pioration and Productio

1050 17th Street, Suite 500

Denver CO 80265

Tel 303 672 6900 • Fax 303 294 9632

Denver Division

May 28, 2003

Division of Oil, Gas, & Mining
1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210
P. O. Box 145801
Salt Lake City, Utah 84114-5801

Attention: JohnBaza/JimThompson

Gentlemen:

This will serve as notice that through the internal corporate changes described below,
activities formerly conducted in the name of either Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC
(SOC) and/or Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI) will hereafter be conducted in the name of
QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.: i) the Shenandoah entities were purchased in July,2001 by Questar
Market Resources, Inc., which is a mid-level holding company for the non-utility businesses
of QuestarCorporation, ii) Shenandoah Operating Company, LLC has now been merged
into Shenandoah Energy, Inc. (SEI), iii) Shenandoah Energy, Inc. has now been re-named

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. pursuant to a State of Delaware Amended and Restated Certiñcate
of Incorporation, iv) the same employees will continue to be responsible for operations of
the former SOC and SEI properties, both in the field and in the office. Accordingly, the
change involves only an internal corporate name change and no third party change of
operator is involved. Please alter your records to reflect the entity name change. Attached is
a spreadsheet listing all wells affected by this change.

Should you have any questions, pleasecall me at 303 - 308-3056.

Yours truly,

rank Nielsen
Division Landman

Enclosure RECEl VED
JUNO2 2003

ON OF OIL,GAS&
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Ros a Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
UT-922

June 9, 2003

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
1050 17thStreet, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Wonsits Valley Urtit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On May 30, 2003, we received an indenture dated February 1, 2003, whereby Shenandoah Energy,
Inc. changed it name and QEP UintaBasin, Inc. was designated as Successor UnitOperator for the
Wonsits Valley Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 ofthe unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective June 9, 2003.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the
designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle it to conduct operations under
Wonsits Valley Unit Agreement.

Your nationwide (Eastern States) oil and gas bond No. BOOOO24willbe used to cover all operations
within the Wonsits Valley Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the name change of unit operator. Copies of
the approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriate federal offices, with one copy
returned herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ Robert A. Henricks

Robert A. Henricks
Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Manager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
Minerals Adjudication Group
File - Wonsits Valley Unit (wlenclosure)
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron
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JUL 0 7 2003
3104 (932.34)WF
Nationwide Bond ESBOOOO24

NOTICE

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. : Oil and Gas
1050 17* Street Suite 500 : lease
Denver, Colorado 80265 :

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been filed in this office concerning the name change of Shenandoah
Energy Incorporated into QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated. QEP Uinta Basin, Incorporated is the
surviving entity. This name change is recognized effective April 17, 2003.

Eastern States will notify the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land
Management offices of the change by a copy of this notice.

If you identify other leases in which the merging entity maintain an interest, please contact this
office and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this notice.

If you have any questions, please contact Bill Forbes at 703-440-1536.

Wilbert B. Forbes
Land Law Examiner

Branch of Use Authorization
Division of Resources Planning,

Use and Protection

bc: JFO,MMS, ES RF, 930 RF, 932.34 RF, E-932: wbf:07 /07/03:440-1536/ QEP Unita



SEl (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

well_name See T R api Entity Lease Type type stat unit_name field county type lease # bond #

WVU 16 _ 15 080S 210E 4304715447 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 21 16 080S 210E 4304715452 99990 State Wl A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVU 31 14 080S 210E 4304715460 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 35 14 080S 210E 4304715463 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 36 10 080S 210E 4304715464 5265 Federal Wl A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S DINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

WVU 41 15 080S 210E 4304715469 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 43 11 080S 210E 4304715471 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

WVU 48 10 080S 210E 4304715476 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

WVU 50 15 080S 210E 4304715477 5265 Federal W1 A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 32 16 080S 210E 4304716513 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVU 53 10 080S 210E 4304720003 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969

WVU 55 14 080S 210E 4304720005 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969

U 59 14 080S 210E 4304720018 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0807 UT-0969

U 60 15 080S 210E 4304720019 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

VU 62 10 080S 210E 4304720024 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

WVU 65 15 080S 210E 4304720041 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 67 15 080S 210E 4304720043 5265 Federal Wl A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 68 15 080S 210E 4304720047 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

VÙ72 16 080S 210E 4304720058 99990 State WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S DINTAH 3 ML-2237A 159261960

WVU 73 16 080S 210E 4304720066 5265 State WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVU 74 16 080S 210E 4304720078 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVU 75 16 080S 210E 4304720085 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVU 78 16 080S 210E 4304720115 99990 State Wl A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVU 83 23 080S 210E 4304720205 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0809 UT-0969

WVU 97 11 080S 210E 4304730014 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 0-0806 UT-0969

WVU 103 14 080S 210E 4304730021 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 104 15 080S 210E 4304730022 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969

iWVU 105 10 080S 210E 4304730023 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969

WŸÜl09 15 080S 210E 4304730045 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 110 14 080S 210E 4304730046 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

VU 112 15 080S 210E 4304730048 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

VU 124 15 080S 210E 4304730745 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH \ U-0806

VU 126 21 080S 210E 4304730796 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0804 UT-0969

WŸ\ 128 10 080S 210E 4304730798 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

WVU 132 15 080S 210E 4304730822 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969

\WVU 136 21 080S 210E 4304731047 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0804 UT-0969

WVU 134 16 080S 210E 4304731118 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVU 137 11 080S 210E 4304731523 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

LWyU 11 080S 210E 4304731524 99990 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969

WVU 141 16 080S 210E 4304731609 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

t 127 16 080S 210E 4304731611 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVU 142 16 080S 210E 4304731612 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710\S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVU 133 15 080S 210E 4304731706 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 140 15 080S 210E 4304731707 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 40-2 10 080S 210E 4304731798 5265 Federal Wl A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

o&g db sorted 1



SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

well name Sec T R api Entity base Type type stat unit name field county type lease # bond #

WVU 144 10 080S 210E 4304731807 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969

WVU 143 10 080S 210E 4304731808 5265 Federal Wl A WONSlTS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

WVU 145 18 080S 220E 4304731820 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-057 UT-0969

WVU 121 14 080S 210E 4304731873 5265 Federal OW S WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVU 135-2 21 080S 210E 4304732016 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0804 UT-0969

WVU 130 22 080S 210E 4304732307 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0804 UT-0969

WVU 71-2 15 080S 210E 4304732449 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVFU l 19 21 080S 210E 4304732461 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0804 UT-0969

WVFU 120 22 080S 210E 4304732462 5265 Federal WI A WONSITS VALLEY 7\0 S UINTAH l U-0804 UT-0969

WVFU 54 WG 07 080S 220E 4304732821 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-22158 UT-0969

WVFU 69 WG 18 080S 220E 4304732829 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-057 UT-0969

WVFU 38 WG 08 080S 220E 4304732831 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-022158 UT-0969

VFU 49 WG 08 080S 220E 4304732832 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

WVFU 138 WG 18 080S 220E 4304733054 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969

WVFU 14 WG 12 080S 210E 4304733070 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-806 UT-0969

WVFU 11 WG 12 080S 210E 4304733085 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969

WVFU 81 WG 24 080S 210E 4304733086 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0810 UT-0969

WVFU 146 WG 19 080S 220E 4304733128 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 630 S UINTAH 1 U-057 UT-0969

WVFU l W-14-8- 21 14 080S 210E 4304733220 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVFU 5W-13- 8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733221 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969

WVFU 9W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733223 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-3084A 159261960

WVFU 46 WG 07 080S 220E .4304733241 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

WVFU 2W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E '4304733246 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVFU 2G-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733247 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVFU 9W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733269 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969

WVFU 7W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733270 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

WVFU l W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733294 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969

WŸFU ll W-i8-22 Ï)ÏÏ 080S 220E 4304733295 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-022158 UT-0969

WVFU 3W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733493 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

WVFU 5W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733494 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

VFU 11W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733495 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

FU 13W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733496 12436 Federal GW P WONSlTS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

WVFU l W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733501 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-022158 UT-0969

WVFU 3W-7-8-22 _ 07 080S 220E 4304733502 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

WV 7WRG-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733503 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 UT-0969

WVFU 6W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733527 12436 State GW P C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVFU 16W-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733529 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0805 UT-0969

WVFU lW-l2-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733531 12436 FedeËd GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969

WVFU lW-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733532 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

WVFU 3W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733533 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-057 UT-0969

WVFU 9W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733534 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969

WVFU l lW-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733535 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

FÜTÏW 155- 13 080S 210E 4304733536 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

WVFU 13W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733537 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969

WVFU 13W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733538 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-057 UT-0969

o&g db sorted 2



SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

well name See T R api Entity Izase Type type stat unit_name field county type lease # bond #

WVFU 6G-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733564 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVFU 16G-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733565 5265 Federal OW P WONSlTS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0805 UT-0969

WVFU 1W-21-8-21 21 080S 1210E 4304733602 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-68217 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E \4304733603 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733604 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0804 UT-0969
WVFU 3W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304733605 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0810 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733606 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733607 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 15W-I3-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733608 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU \W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304733613 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0810 UT-0969
WVFU ll W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733626 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 16W-2-8-21 02 080S 210E 4304733645 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2785 159261960

VFU 9W-2-8-21 02 080S 210E 4304733648 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 2 S UINTAH 3 ML-2785 159261960
VFU 12W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733649 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVFU 12G-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304733650 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WVFU 2W-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733655 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 4W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733657 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 12W-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733659 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 12G-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733660 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 15W-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733661 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0805 UT-0969
WVFU 15G-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733662 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0805 UT-0969
WVFU 2W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733791 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733792 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733793 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-l-8-21 Ol 080S 210E 4304733794 12436 Federal GW S WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0802 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-l3-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733795 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 16W-l3-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733796 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-3084 159261960

WVFU 6W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733811 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 1 U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 7W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733812 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

VFU 10W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733813 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969
VFU 10W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733814 13450 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-022158 UT-0969

WVFU 12W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733815 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 14W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733816 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 16W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733817 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-7-8-22 07 0808 220E 4304733828 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-022158 UT-0969
WVFU 6W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733842 12436 Federal GW P C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 6WC-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733843 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 6WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733844 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969 i
WVFU 5W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733860 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0809 UT-0969
WVFU 7W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733861 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0809 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733862 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733863 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 14W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733864 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 16W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733865 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I U-0806 UT-0969

o&g db sorted 3



SEl (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

well name Sec T R api Entity Lease Type type stat unit name field county type lease # bond #
WVFU l W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733902 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 1W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733903 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-06304 UT-0969
WVFU \W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733904 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0809 UT-0969

WVFU 6W-l1-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733906 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WV 7W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733907 13230 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0804 UT-0969
WVFU 7W-24-8-21 24

,
080S 210E 4304733908 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0810 UT-0969

WVFU 10W-l l-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733910 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU llW-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733911 12436 Federal GW P WONSITSVALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU ll W-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304733912 13228 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 2 S UINTAH l UTU-68219 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-I1-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733913 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 13W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733914 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 15W-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733916 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969

à VFU W-L53-21 15 _ 080S 210E 2436 GW P 0 S _UINTAH __1

1 WVFU 5W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733953 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 7W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733955 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-I 1-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733957 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733958 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 9W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733959 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 12W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733961 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 14W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733962 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WVFU 15W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733963 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0807 UT-0969
WVFU 2W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733986 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
WV SW-l8-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733989 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-9617 UT-0969
WVFU 10W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733991 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 12W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733993 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-057 UT-0969
WV 14W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733995 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-057 UT-0969
WVFU 6W 8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734008 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0802 UT-0969
WVFU 8W-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734009 12436 Federal GW DRL C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0802 UT-0969
WV 10G-2-8-21 02 080S 210E 4304734035 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 2 S UINTAH 3 ML-2785 159261960
WV 14G-2-8-21 02 080S 210E 4304734036 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2785 159261960

V 4W-17-8-22 17 080S 220E 4304734038 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-055 UT-0969
V 16W-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734047 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-0802 UT-0969

WV 13G-2-8-21 02 080S 210E 4304734068 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2785-A 159261960
WV 5G-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734107 5265 State OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 12G-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734108 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0802 UT-0969
WV 2W-l4-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734140 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 U-0969
GH 2W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734141 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0804 U-0969
W 2W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734142 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0809 U-0969
GH 3W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734143 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0804 U-0969
WV 4W-l3-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304734144 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
GH 4W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734145 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0804 UT-0969
WV 4W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734146 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0804 U-0969
WV 16W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734155 12436 Federal GW S WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 3W-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734187 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 630 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969

WV 4W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734188 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-809 UT-0969

o&gdb sorted 4



SEl (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

well_ name See T R api Entity Lease Type type stat unit name ficId county type Icase # bond #
WV 6W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734189 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l UTU-809 UT-0969
WV l lW-16-L21 16 080S 210E 4304734190 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 13W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734191 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237A 159261960
WV 14W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734192 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 15W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734224 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 16W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734225 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237A 159261960
WV 2W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734242 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 2W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734243 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0804 UT-0969
WV 4W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734244 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969
WV 6W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734245 12436 Federal GW TA WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
WV 7W-l5-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734246 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-0807 UT-0969
WV 8W-l5-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734247 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969

V 12W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734248 12436 Federal GW TA WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l U-0806 UT-0969
V 14W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734249 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH 1 UTU-0807 UT-0969

W 16W-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304734250 12436 Federal GW P WONSlTS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 16W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734251 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV lW-!1-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734263 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 2W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734264 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 2W-l2-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734265 12436 Federal GW DRL C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 3W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734266 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 3W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734267 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969

-Ï25-21 12 080S 210E 4304734268 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 5W-I 1-8-21 I 1 080S 210E 4304734269 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 5W-I2-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734270 12436 Federal GW DRL C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 6W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734271 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 9W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734274 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 10W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734275 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 11W-11-8-21 I 1 080S 210E 4304734276 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV llW-l4-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734277 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 12W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734278 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0806 UT-0969

Ÿ 2W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734279 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
V 14W-I1-8-2I 11 080S 210E 4304734280 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0806 UT-0969

WV 14W-l4-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734281 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 15W-1I-8-2l 11 080S 210E 4304734282 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I UTU-0806 UT-0969
WV 16W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734283 5265 Federal OW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV lilÃÃ- 16 080S 210E 4304734288 State GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WŸiW-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734289 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 7\0 S UINTAH I UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 3W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734290 State GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 4W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734291 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH \ UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 4W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734292 State GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 5W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734293 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV §¶-15-8-21_ 15 080S 210E 4304734294 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0807 UT-0969
WV 10W-l5-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734295 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-0807 UT-0969
WVU 5W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734321 12436 State GW DRL WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 04127294
WV 7W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734322 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

o&g db sorted 5



SEI (N4235) to QEP (N2460) WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

well name Sec T R api Entity Lease Type type stat unit name field | county type lease # bond #
WV 8W-l6-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734323 State GW APD WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 9W-l6-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734325 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960
WV 10W-16-8-21 16 080S 210E 4304734326 12436 State GW P WONSITS VALLEY

.
710 S UINTAH 3 ML-2237 159261960

WVU 4W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734330 12436 Federal GW P WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0810 U-0969
WVU 2W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734337 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0810 UT-0969
WVU 6W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734338 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0810 UT-0969
WVU BW-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734339 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0809 UT-0969
WVU 8W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734340 12436 Federal GW P C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0810 UT-0969
WV 2G-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734355 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV 2W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734356 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-02215 UT-09ð9
WV 4G-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734357 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH I UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV 4WA-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734358 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969

4WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734359 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-057 UT-0969
13WA-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734361 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969

WV 13WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734362 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 2WA-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734426 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 2WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734427 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 3WA-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734428 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 3WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304734429 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-057 UT-0969
WV 4W-8-8-22 ___ 08 080S 220E 4304734457 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV l W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734467 Federal GW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV 2W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734468 12436 Federal GW P C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV 8W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734469 12436 Federal GW DRL C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 UT-0969
WV 8W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734564 12436 Federal GW P C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-0804 U-0969
WV 3G-8-8-22 _ 08 080S 220E 4304734596 5265 Federal OW TA C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UlNTAH l U-022158 U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY lG-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734597 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 U-022l58 U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 5G-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734612 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-02215 U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 7G-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734613 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-76508 U-0969
WV ll G-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734614 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 U-0969
WV 13G-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734615 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-022l5 U-0969

V 15G-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734626 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH 1 UTU-02215 U-0969
Vl lG-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734627 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 U-0969

WONSITS VALLEY 7G-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734628 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 710 S UINTAH l UTU-02215 U-0969
WONSITS VALLEY 9G-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734629 Federal OW APD C WONSITS VALLEY 7\0 S UINTAH I UTU-02215 U-0969
WV EXT 2W-17-8-21 17 080S 210E 4304734928 12436 Federal GW DRL C WONSITS VALLEY 610 S UINTAH I UTU-68219 UT-1237

o&gdb sorted 6



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. DJJ

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 1/1/2007

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N2460-QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. N5085-QuestarE&P Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900 Phone: 1 (303) 672-6900

CA No. Unit: WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

SEE ATTACHED LISTS *

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 4/19/2007

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 4/16/2007

3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 1/31/2005

4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143

Sa. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: IN PLACE
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: n/a

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 4/23/2007 BIA

7. Federal and Indian Units:
The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 4/23/2007

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):
The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on:

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to
Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on:

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESBOOOO24
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 799446
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965003033
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a

COMMENTS: THIS IS A COMPANY NAME CHANGE.
SOME WELL NAMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED AS REQUESTED

Questar E&P FORM A.xls 4/30/2007 AND



1 of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WVU 16 WV 16 NENE 15 080S 210E 4304715447 5265 Federal WI A
YV\'1031 TVV31 Ì¾EÌ¾¾V 14 080S 210E 4304715460 5265 Federal 3WI A
YVV1335 TVV35 TÆESTV 14 080S 210E 4304715463 5265 Federal 3VI A
YVV36 TVV36 f(ESTV 10 080S 210E 4304715464 5265 Federal 'NI A
TVVU41 TVV41 14E1497 15 080S 210E 4304715469 5265 Federal INI A

TVV43 VVV43 SV/SVV 11 080S 210E 4304715471 5265 Federal COW P
TVV48 VVV48 SNVNE 10 080S 210E 4304715476 5265 Federal CTw' P
TIVB50 __ TVV50 SVV>JE 15 080S 210E 4304715477 5265 Fedenil /I A
VVV53 VVV53 STVSE 10 080S 210E 4304720003 5265 Federal OVV P
TVVU55 VVV55 SVn9E 14 080S 210E 4304720005 5265 Federal ONV P
WVU 59 WV 59 SWNW 14 080S 210E 4304720018 5265 Federal WI A
WVU 60 'WV 60 SWSE 15 080S 210E 4304720019 5265 Federal WI A
NVV62 TVV62 STVSYV 10 080S 210E 4304720024 5265 Federal CBW P
TVV1365 TVV65 STV>PN 15 080S 210E 4304720041 5265 Federal CBW P
TVVU67 TVV67 NESTV 15 080S 210E 4304720043 5265 Federal M'I A

V1368 VVV68 f(ESE 15 080S 210E 4304720047 5265 Federal VVI A

VVU83 TVV83 TVGi NEbn¥ 23 080S 210E 4304720205 14864 Federal GNV S
9/V97 VVV97 ffY/SVV 11 080S 210E 4304730014 5265 Federal NI A
TV\nJ 103 VVV103 FDAfiví 14 080S 210E 4304730021 5265 Federal__ Cint P
WVU 104 WV 104 NWNE 15 080S 210E 4304730022 5265 Federal OW P
TVV 105 VVV105 SESE 10 080S 210E 4304730023 5265 Federal OV/ P
VVV1]109 VVV109 SE14E 15 080S 210E 4304730045 5265 Federal ONV P
WVU 110 WV 110 SENW 14 080S 210E 4304730046 5265 Federal OW P
TV\nD 112 VVV112 SE2497 15 080S 210E 4304730048 5265 Federal OiV P
VV\nl 124 VVV124 kJV/SE 15 080S 210E 4304730745 5265 Federal ONV P
NV\nl 126 VVV126 FPATVE 21 080S 210E 4304730796 5265 Fedenil VVI A

TVV 128 V7V 128 SESNV 10 080S 210E 4304730798 5265 Federal OVV P
VVVl] 132 NVV132 NVISTV 15 080S 210E 4304730822 5265 Federal OVV P
TVVU 136 VVV136 NEhDW 21 080S 210E 4304731047 5265 Federal Ò3N S
TVV 137 VVV137 SElfv/ 11 080S 210E 4304731523 5265 Federal O'N P
ÑV 28-2 WV 28-2 NESW ll 080S 210E 4304731524 99990 Federal WI A

TVVU 133 M'V 133 SESVV 15 080S 210E 4304731706 5265 Federal ONV P
TV\fD 140 MrV 140 blAfiv/ 15 080S 210E 4304731707 5265 Federal 3NI A
VVV40-2 TVV40-2 ffESE 10 080S 210E 4304731798 5265 Federal MrI A
VIVU 144 TVV 144 SENE 10 080S 210E 4304731807 5265 Federal CnW P
WV 143 WV 143 NWSE 10 080S 210E 4304731808 5265 Federal WI A
WVU 145 WV 145 NWNW 18 080S 220E 4304731820 14864 Federal GW P
WVU 121 WV 121 NWSW 14 080S 210E 4304731873 5265 Federal OW ÌÃ
WVU 135-2 WV 135-2 NENE 21 080S 210E 4304732016 5265 Federal ÒW P
VVVU 130 TVV 130 NYTNTV 22 080S 210E 4304732307 5265 Federal ONV P
NVinO71-2 TVV71-2 SVISYV 15 080S 210E 4304732449 5265 Federal V/I



2 of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (NSO85) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WVFU 119 WV 119 NWNW 21 080S 210E 4304732461 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 120 WV 120 NENW 22 080S 210E 4304732462 5265 Federal WI A
WVFU 54 WG WV 54 WG SWSE 07 080S 220E 4304732821 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 69 WG WV 69 WG SWNE 18 080S 220E 4304732829 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 38 WG WV 38 WG SWNW 08 080S 220E 4304732831 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 49 WG WV 49 WG SWSW 08 080S 220E 4304732832 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 138 WG WV 138 WG SWNW 18 080S 220E 4304733054 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 14 WG WV 14 WG SWSE 12 080S 210E 4304733070 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11 WG WV 11 WG SWNE 12 080S 210E 4304733085 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 81 WG WV 81 WG SWNW 24 080S 210E 4304733086 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 146 WG WV 146 WG NWNW 19 080S 220E 4304733128 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU lW-14-8- 21 WV 1W-14-8- 21 NENE 14 080S 210E 4304733220 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 5W-13- 8-21 WV 5W-13- 8-21 SWNW 13 080S 210E 4304733221 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 46 WG WVFU 46 WG NESE 07 080S 220E 4304733241 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 9W-14-8-21 WV 9W-14-8-21 NESE 14 080S 210E 4304733269 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 7W-13-8-21 WV 7W-13-8-21 SWNE 13 080S 210E 4304733270 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 1W-18-8-22 WV lW-18-8-22 NENE 18 080S 220E 4304733294 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11W-8-8-22 WV llW-8-8-22 NESW 08 080S 220E 4304733295 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-8-8-22 WV 3W-8-8-22 NENW 08 080S 220E 4304733493 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 5W-7-8-22 WV 5W-7-8-22 SWNW 07 080S 220E 4304733494 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11W-7-8-22 WV 11W-7-8-22 NESW 07 080S 220E 4304733495 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 13W-7-8-22 WV 13W-7-8-22 SWSW 07 080S 220E 4304733496 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU lW-7-8-22 WV 1W-7-8-22 NENE 07 080S 220E 4304733501 14864 1ederal GW P
WVFU 3W-7-8-22 WV 3W-7-8-22 NENW 07 080S 220E 4304733502 14864 Federal GW P
WV 7WRG-7-8-22 WV 7WRG-7-8-22 SWNE 07 080S 220E 4304733503 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 16W-9-8-21 WV 16W-9-8-21 SESE 09 080S 210E 4304733529 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU lW-12-8-21 WV lW-12-8-21 NENE 12 080S 210E 4304733531 14864 Federal GW
WVFU lW-13-8-21 WV lW-13-8-21 NENE 13 080S 210E 4304733532 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-18-8-22 WV 3W-18-8-22 NENW 18 080S 220E 4304733533 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 9W-12-8-21 WV 9W-12-8-21 NESE 4Z64
WVFU 11W-12-8-21 WV 11W-12-8-21 NESW 12 080S 210E 4304733535 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11W-13-8-21 (WV 11W-13-8-21 NESW 13 080S 210E 4304733536 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 13W-12-8-21 IWV 13W-12-8-21 SWSW 12 080S 210E 4304733537 14864 Federal GW _ S
WVFU 13W-18-8-22 WV 13W-18-8-22 SWSW 18 080S 220E 4304733538 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 16G-9-8-21 WV 16G-9-8-21 SESE 09 080S 210E 4304733565 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 1W-21-8-21 WV 1W-21-8-21 NENE 21 080S 210E 4304733602 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-13-8-21 WV 3W-13-8-21 NENW 13 080S 210E 4304733603 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 3W-22-8-21 WV 3W-22-8-21 NENW 22 080S 210E 4304733604 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 3W-24-8-21 WV 3W-24-8-21 NENW 24 080S 210E 4304733605 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 13W-13-8-21 WV 13W-13-8-21 SWSW 13 080S 210E 4304733606 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 13W-14-8-21 WV 13W-14-8-21 SWSW 14 080S 210E 4304733607 14864 Federal GW



3 of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WVFU 15W-13-8-21 WV 15W-13-8-21 SWSE 13 080S 210E 4304733608 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 1W-24-8-21 WV lW-24-8-21 NENE 24 080S 210E 4304733613 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11W-18-8-22 WV 11W-18-8-22 NESW 18 080S 220E 4304733626 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-10-8-21 WV 2W-10-8-21 NWNE 10 080S 210E 4304733655 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4W-11-8-21 WV 4W-11-8-21 NWNW 11 080S 210E 4304733657 14864 Federal GW P
WV 12W-10-8-21 WV 12W-10-8-21 NWSW 10 080S 210E 4304733659 14864 Federal GW S
WV 12G-10-8-21 WV 12G-10-8-21 NWSW 10 080S 210E 4304733660 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 15W-9-8-21 WV 15W-9-8-21 SWSE 09 080S 210E 4304733661 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 15G-9-8-21 WV 15G-9-8-21 SWSE 09 080S 210E 4i04733662 5265 Federal OW P
WVFU 2W-13-8-21 WV 2W-13-8-21 NWNE 13 080S 210E 4304733791 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6W-13-8-21 WV 6W-13-8-21 SENW 13 080S 210E 4304733792 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 8W-13-8-21 WV 8W-13-8-21 SENE 13 080S 210E 4304733793 14864 Federal GW P
WV 10W-1-8-21 WV 10W-1-8-21 NWSE 01 080S 210E 4304733794 14864 Federal GW TA
WVFU 10W-13-8-21 WV 10W-13-8-21 NWSE 13 080S 210E 4304733795 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 12W-7-8-22 WV 12W-7-8-22 NWSW 07 080S 220E 4304733808 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6W-8-8-22 WV 6W-8-8-22 SENW 08 080S 220E 4304733811 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 7W-8-8-22 WV 7W-8-8-22 SWNE 08 080S 220E 4304733812 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 10W-7-8-22 WV 10W-7-8-22 NWSE 07 080S 220E 4304733813 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 12W-8-8-22 WV 12W-8-8-22 NWSW 08 080S 220E 4304733815 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 14W-7-8-22 WV 14W-7-8-22 SESW 07 080S 220E 4304733816 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 16W-7-8-22 WV 16W-7-8-22 SESE 07 080S 220E 4304733817 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6W-7-8-22 WV 6W-7-8-22 SENW 07 080S 220E 4304733828 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6W-18-8-22 WV 6W-18-8-22 SENW 18 080S 220E 4304733842 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6WC-18-8-22 WV 6WC-18-8-22 SENW 18 080S 220E 4304733843 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 6WD-18-8-22 WV 6WD-18-8-22 SENW 18 080S 220E 4304733844 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 5W-23-8-21 WV 5W-23-8-21 SWNW 23 080S 210E 4304733860 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 7W-23-8-21 WV 7W-23-8-21 SWNE 23 080S 210E 4304733861 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 8W-12-8-21 WV 8W-12-8-21 SENE 12 080S 210E 4304733862 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 10W-12-8-21 WV 10W-12-8-21 NWSE 12 080S 210E 4304733863 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 14W-12-8-21 WV 14W-12-8-21 SESW 12 080S 210E 4304733864 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 16W-12-8-21 WV 16W-12-8-21 SESE 12 080S 210E 4304733865 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU lW-15-8-21 WV 1W-15-8-21 NENE 15 080S 210E 4304733902 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 1W-22-8-21 WV 1W-22-8-21 NENE 22 080S 210E 4304733903 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 1W-23-8-21 WV 1W-23-8-21 NENE 23 080S 210E 4304733904 14864 Federal GW P
WV 6W-11-8-21 WV 6W-11-8-21 SENW 11 080S 210E 4304733906 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 7W-24-8-21 WV 7W-24-8-21 SWNE 24 080S 210E 4304733908 14864 Federal GW P
WV 10W-11-8-21 WV 10W-11-8-21 NWSE 11 080S 210E 4304733910 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 11W-15-8-21 WV llW-15-8-21 NESW 15 080S 210E 4304733911 14864 Federal GW P
WV 13W-11-8-21 WV 13W-11-8-21 SWSW 11 080S 210E 4304733913 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 13W-15-8-21 WV 13W-15-8-21 SWSW 15 080S 210E 4304733914 14864 Federal GW P
WV 15W-10-8-21 WV 15W-10-8-21 SWSE 10 080S 210E 4304733916 : 14864 Federal GW



4 of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WVFU 15W-15-8-21 WV 15W-15-8-21 SWSE 15 080S 210E 4304733917 14864 Federal GW ___ P
WVFU 5W-14-8-21 WV 5W-14-8-21 SWNW 14 080S 210E 4304733953 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 7W-14-8-21 WV 7W-14-8-21 SWNE 14 080S 210E 4304733955 14864 Federal GW P
WV 8W-11-8-21 WV 8W-11-8-21 SENE 11 080S 210E 4304733957 14864 Federal GW S
WVFU 8W-14-8-21 WV 8W-14-8-21 SENE 14 080S 210E 4304733958 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 9W-15-8-21 WV 9W-15-8-21 NESE 15 080S 210E 4304733959 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 12W-13-8-21 WV 12W-13-8-21 NWSW 13 080S 210E 4304733961 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 14W-13-8-21 WV 14W-13-8-21 SESW 13 080S 210E 4304733962 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 15W-14-8-21 WV 15W-14-8-21 SWSE 14 080S 210E 4304733963 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 2W-18-8-22 WV 2W-18-8-22 NWNE 18 080S 220E 4304733986 14864 Federal GW P
WV 8W-18-8-22 WV 8W-18-8-22 SENE 18 080S 220E 4304733989 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 10W-18-8-22 WV 10W-18-8-22 NWSE 18 080S 220E 4304733991 14864 Ìederal GW P
WVFU 12W-18-8-22 WV Ï2WA8-8-22 NWSW 18 080S 220E 4304733993 14864 Federal GW P
W 14W-18-8-22 WV 14W-18-8-22 SESW 18 080S 220E 4304733995 14864 Federal GW P
WVFU 8W-1-8-21 WV 8W-1-8-21 SENE 01 080S 210E 4304734009 14864 Federal GW DRL
WV 4W-17-8-22 WV 4W-17-8-22 NWNW 17 080S 220E 4304734038 14864 Federal GW P
WV 12G-1-8-21 WV 12G-1-8-21 NWSW 01 080S 210E 4304734108 5265 Federal OW TA
WV 2W-14-8-21 WV 2W-14-8-21 NWNE 14 080S 210E 4304734140 14864 Federal GW P
GH 2W-21-8-21 GH 2W-21-8-21 NWNE 21 080S 210E 4304734141 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-23-8-21 WV 2W-23-8-21 NWNE 23 080S 210E 4304734142 14864 Federal GW P
GH 3W-21-8-21 WV 3W-21-8-21 NENW 21 080S 210E 4304734143 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4W-13-8-21 WV 4W-13-8-21 NWNW 13 080S 210E 4304734144 14864 Federal GW P
GH 4W-21-8-21 WV 4W-21-8-21 NWNW 21 080S 210E 4304734145 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4W-22-8-21 WV 4W-22-8-21 NWNW 22 080S 210E 4304734146 14864 Federal GW P
WV 16W-11-8-21 WV 16W-ll-8-21 SESE 11 080S 210E 4304734155 14864 Federal GW TA
WV 3W-19-8-22 WV 3W-19-8-22 NENW 19 080S 220E 4304734187 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4W-23-8-21 WV 4W-23-8-21 NWNW 23 080S 210E 4304734188 14864 Federal GW P
WV 6W-23-8-21 WV 6W-23-8-21 SENW 23 080S 210E 430494189 14864 Federal GW P
NWV2W-15-8-21 WV 2W-15-8-21 NWNE 15 080S 210E 4304734242 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-22-8-21 WV 2W-22-8-21 NWNE 22 080S 210E 4304734243 14864 Federal GW P

4W-14-8-21 V 4W-14-8-21 NWNW 14 080S 210E 4304734244 14864 Federal GW P
WV 6W-12-8-21 WV 6W-12-8-21 SENW 12 080S 210E 4304734245 5265 Federal GW S

7W-15-8-21 WV 7W-15-8-21 SWNE 15 080S 210E 4304734246 14864 Federal GW P
8W-15-8-21 WV 8W-15-8-21 SENE 15 080S 210E 4304734247 14864 Federal GW P
12W-12-8-21 WV 12W-12-8-21 NWSW 12 080S 210E 4304734248 14864 Federal GW S

WV 14W-15-8-21 WV 14W-15-8-21 SESW 15 080S 210E 4304734249 14864 Federal GW P
WV 16W-10-8-21 WV 16W-10-8-21 SESE 10 080S 210E 4304734250 14864 Federal GW P
WV 16W-15-8-21 WV 16W-15-8-21 SESE 15 080S 210E 4304734251 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-12-8-21 WV 2W-12-8-21 NWNE 12 080S 210E 4304734265 14864 Federal GW OPS
WV 3W-12-8-21 WV 3W-12-8-21 NENW 12 080S 210E 4304734267 14864 Federal GW OPS
WV 4W-12-8-21 WV 4D-12-8-21 NWNW 12 080S 210E 4304734268 12436 Federal GW



5 of 5 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WV 5W-12-8-21 WV 5W-12-8-21 SWNW 12 080S 210E 4304734270 14864 Federal GW OPS
WV 6W-14-8-21 WV 6W-14-8-21 SENW 14 080S 210E 4304734271 14864 Federal GW P
WV 9W-11-8-21 WV 9W-11-8-21 NESE 11 080S 210E 4304734274 14864 Federal GW DRL
WV 10W-14-8-21 WV 10W-14-8-21 NWSE 14 080S 210E 4304734275 14864 Federal GW S
WV llW-14-8-21 WV 11W-14-8-21 NESW 14 080S 210E 430473457 GW P
WV 12W-14-8-21 WV 12W-14-8-21 NVÏSW 14 080S 210E 4304734279 14864 Federal GW S
WV 14M-11-8-21 WV 14M-11-8-21 SESW 11 080S 210E 4304734280 14864 Federal GW P
WV 14W-14-8-21 WV 14W-14-8-21 SESW 14 080S 210E 4304734281 14864 P
WV 16W-14-8-21 WV 16G-14-8-21 SESE 14 080S 210E 4304734283 5265 Federal OW S
WV 3MU-15-8-21 WV 3MU-15-8-21 NENW 15 080S 210E 4304734289 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4MU-15-8-21 WV 4MU-15-8-21 NWNW 15 080S 210E 4304734291 14864 Federal GW P
WV 5MU-15-8-21 WV 5MU-15-8-21 SWNW 15 080S 210E 4304734293 14864 Federal GW P
WV 6W-15-8-21 WV 6W-15-8-21 SENW 15 080S 210E 4304734294 14864 Federal GW P
WV 10W-15-8-21 WV 10W-15-8-21 NWSE 15 080S 210E 4304734295 14864 Federal GW P
WVU 4W-24-8-21 WV 4W-24-8-21 NWNW 24 080S 210E 4304734330 14864 Federal GW P
WV 8M-23-8-21 WV 8M-23-8-21 SENE 23 080S 210E 4304734339 14864 Federal GW P
WVU 8W-24-8-21 WV 8W-24-8-21 SENE 24 080S 210E 4304734340 14864 Federal GW P
WV 2W-8-8-22 WV 2W-8-8-22 NWNE 08 080S 220E 4304734468 14864 Federal GW P
WV 8W-7-8-22 WV 8W-7-8-22 SENE 07 080S 220E 4304734469 14864 Federal GW S
WV 8W-22-8-21 WV 8W-22-8-21 SENE 22 080S 210E 4304734564 14864 Federal GW P
WV 3G-8-8-22 WV 3G-8-8-22 NENW 08 080S 220E 4304734596 5265 Federal OW TA
WV 14MU-10-8-21 WV 14MU-10-8-21 SESW 10 080S 210E 4304735879 14864 Federal GW P
WV 13MU-10-8-21 WV 13MU-10-8-21 SWSW 10 080S 210E 4304736305 14864 Federal GW P
WV 3DML-13-8-21 WV 3D-13-8-21 SENW 13 080S 210E 4304737923 14864 Federal GW DRL
WV 14DML-12-8-21 WV 14DML-12-8-21 SESW 12 080S 210E 4304737924 14864 Federal GW DRL
WV 15AML-12-8-21 WV 15AML-12-8-21 NWSE 12 080S 210E 4304737925 Federal GW APD
WV 13DML-10-8-21 WV 13DML-10-8-21 SWSW 10 080S 210E 4304737926 14864 Federal GW P
WV 4DML-15-8-21 WV 4DML-15-8-21 NWNW 15 080S 210E 4304737927 14864 Federal GW DRL
WV 13AD-8-8-22 WV 13AD-8-8-22 SWSW 08 080S 220E 4304737945 Federal GW APD
WV llAML-14-8-21 WV 11AD-14-8-21 NWSE 14 080S 210E 4304738049 15899 Federal GW APD
WV 11DML-14-8-21 ESW _ M - K GW APD
WV 4AML-19-8-22 WV 4AML-19-8-22 NWNW 19 080S 220E 4304738051 Federal GW APD
WV 13CML-8-8-22 WV 13CML-8-8-22 SWSW 08 080S 220E 4304738431 Federal GW APD
WV 13BML-18-8-22 WV 13BML-18-8-22 SWSW 18 080S 220E 4304738432
WV 8BML-18-8-22 WV 8BML-18-8-22 E/NE 18 080S 220E 4304738433 Federal GW APD
WV 6ML-24-8-21 WV 6-24-8-21 SENW 24 080S 210E 4304738663 Federal GW APD
WV 2ML-24-8-21 WV 2ML-24-8-21 NWNE 24 080S 210E 4304738664 Federal GW APD
WV 1DML-13-8-21 WV IDML-13-8-21 NENE 13 080S 210E 4304738733 Federal GW APD
WV 4DML-13-8-21 WV 4DML-13-8-21 NWNW 13 080S 210E 4304738734 Federal GW APD
WV 3AML-14-8-21 WV 3AML-14-8-21 NENW 14 080S 210E 4304738736 Federal GW APD
WV 16CML-14-8-21 WV 16C-14-8-21 SESE 14 080S 210E 4304738737 Federal GW



1 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Nanie Well Name & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WVU 21 WV 21 NENE 16 080S 210E 4304715452 99990 State WI A
WVU 32 WV 32 NENW 16 080S 210E 4304716513 5265 State OW P
WVU 72 WV 72 SWSW 16 080S 210E 4304720058 99990 State WI A
WVU 73 WV 73 NESE 16 080S 210E 4304720066 5265 State WI A
WVU 74 WV 74 SWSE 16 080S 210E 4304720078 5265 State OW P
WVU 75 WV 75 SWNE 16 080S 210E 4304720085 5265 State OW P
WVU 78 WV 78 NESW 16 080S 210E 4304720115 _99990 State WI A
WVU 134 WV 134 SESE 16 080S 210E 4304731118 5265 State OW P
WVU 141 WV 141 NWSE 16 080S 210E 4304731609 5265 State OW P
WVU 127 WV 127 SENE 16 080S 210E 4304731611 5265 State OW P
WVU 142 WV 142 SESW 16 080S 210E 4304731612 5265 State OW P
WVFU 9W-13-8-21 WV 9W-13-8-21 NESE 13 080S 210E 4304733223 14864 State GW S
WVFU 2W-16-8-21 WV 2W-16-8-21 NWNE 16 080S 210E 4304733246 14864 State GW P
WVFU 2G-16-8-21 WV 2G-16-8-21 NWNE 16 080S 210E 4304733247 5265 State OW P
WVFU 6W-16-8-21 WV 6W-16-8-21 SENW 16 080S 210E 4304733527 14864 State GW P
WVFU 6G-16-8-21 WV 6G-16-8-21 SENW 16 080S 210E 4304733564 5265 State OW P
WVFU 16W-2-8-21 WV 16W-2-8-21 SESE 02 080S 210E 4304733645 5265 State OW S
WVFU 9W-2-8-21 WV 9W-2-8-21 NESE 02 080S 210E 4304733648 14864 State GW P
WVFU 12W-16-8-21 WV 12W-16-8-21 NWSW 16 080S 210E 4304733649 14864 State GW P
WVFU 12G-16-8-21 WV 12G-16-8-21 NWSW 16 080S 210E 4304733650 5265 State OW P
WVFU 16W-13-8-21 WV 16W-13-8-21 SESE 13 080S 210E 4304733796 14864 State GW P
WV 10G-2-8-21 WV 10G-2-8-21 NWSE 02 080S 210E 4304734035 5265 State OW P
WV 14G-2-8-21 WV 14G-2-8-21 SESW 02 080S 210E 4304734036 5265 State OW P
WV 13G-2-8-21 WV 13G-2-8-21 SWSW 02 080S 210E 4304734068 5265 State OW P
WV 5G-16-8-21 WV 5G-16-8-21 SWNW 16 080S 210E 4304734107 5265 State OW P
WV 11W-16-8-21 WV 11W-16-8-21 NESW 16 080S 210E 4304734190 14864 State GW P
WV 13W-16-8-21 WV 13W-16-8-21 SWSW 16 080S 210E 4304734191 14864 State GW P
WV 14W-16-8-21 WV 14W-16-8-21 SESW 16 080S 210E 4304734192 14864 State GW P
WV 15W-16-8-21 WV 15W-16-8-21 SWSE 16 080S 210E 4304734224 14864 State GW P
WV 16W-16-8-21 WV 16W-16-8-21 SESE 16 080S 210E 4304734225 14864 State GW P
WV 1MU-16-8-21 WV 1MU-16-8-21 NENE 16 080S 210E 4304734288 14864 State GW P
WV 3W-16-8-21 WV 3W-16-8-21 NENW 16 080S 210E 4304734290 State GW LA
WV 4W-16-8-21 WV 4W-16-8-21 NWNW 16 080S 210E 4304734292 12436 State D PA
WVU 5W-16-8-21 WV 5W-16-8-21 SWNW 16 080S 210E 4304734321 14864 State GW P
WV 7W-16-8-21 WV 7W-16-8-21 SWNE 16 080S 210E 4304734322 14864 State GW P
WV 8ML-16-8-21 WV 8ML-16-8-21 SENE 16 080S 210E 4304734323 14864 GW P
WV 9W-16-8-21 WV 9W-16-8-21 INESE 16 080S 210E 4304734325 14864 State GW P
WV 10W-16-8-21 WV 10W-16-8-21 NWSE 16 080S 210E 4304734326 14864 State GW P
WV 12BML-16-8-21 WV 12BML-16-8-21 SWNW 15 080S 210E 4304737824 14864 State GW P
WV 12DML-16-8-21 WV 12D-16-8-21 NWSW 16 080S 210E 4304737870 State GW APD
WV 15CML-16-8-21 WV 15CML-16-8-21 SESW 16 080S 210E 4304737871 14864 State GW



2 of 2 QEP Uinta Basin (N2460) to QUESTAR E and P (N5085) 4/30/2007 and 5/15/2007
WONSITS VALLEYUNIT

Original Well Name WellName & No. Q/Q SEC TWP RNG API Entity Lease Well Type Status

WV 15DML-16-8-21 WV 15DML-16-8-21 SWSE 16 080S 210E 4304737872 State GW APD
WV 16DML-13-8-21 WV 16DML-13-8-21 ,SESE 13 080S 210E 4304738735 State GW



STATEOFUTAH FORM9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 NDIAN ALhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CAAGREEMENTNAME:
Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells, significantlydeepen existingwellsbelow currentbottom-hole depth, reenterplugged welts,or to See attacheddrillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for suchproposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OIL WELL O GAS WELL OTHER see attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATÖR: 9. API NUMBER:

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached
3. ADDRESSOF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 crr r Denver CO a, 80265 (303) 308-3068

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: attached COUNTY: Uintah

QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ^clotze O DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007
[¯]

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofworkcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective January 1, 2007 operator of record, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc., willhereafter be known as QUESTAR EXPLORATION
AND PRODUCTION COMPANY. This name change involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty
change ofoperator is involved. The same employees willcontinue to be responsible for operations of the properties described
on the attached list. Alloperations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLMReference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965003033
Fee Land Bond Number: 965003033
Current operator of record, QEP UINTABASIN, IN ereby igns as operator of the properties as described on the
attached list.

Ja '
, Executive Vice President, QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.

Successor operator of record, QUESTAR EXPLORATIO ÑD P UCTION COMPANY, hereby assumes all rights, duties
and obligations as operator of the properties as descr ed on the ttached list

Jayf. Neese, Exe tiveVice President
Qtfestar Exploration and Production Company

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) DybSK. Stanberry ) ) TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE DATE 3/16/2007

(This space for State use only)

APRI S 2007
(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse



STATEOFUTAH FORMS
DEPARTMENTOF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

see attached

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 IFINDIAN ALhLOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENTNAME:
°"°i"' '°rm for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to See attacheddrillhorizontal laterals Use APPLICATIONFOR PERM1TTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL 8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER see attached
2.NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9.APINUMBER:

QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION COMPANY attached
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:
1050 17th Street Suite 500 Denver

sixrE CO m, 80265 (303) 308-3068
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE attached COUNTY: Uintah

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURETREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEWCONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

1/1/2007 CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUGANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(START/RESUME) WATERSHUT-OFF
Date of workcompletion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE OTHER: Well Name Changes
CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

PER THE ATTACHEDLIST OF WELLS, QUESTAR EXPLORATIONAND PRODUCTION COMPANYREQUESTS THATTHE
INDIVIDUALWELL NAMES BE UPDATED INYOUR RECORDS.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) D K. Sta erry
TITLE Supervisor, Regulatory Affairs

SIGNATURE 4/17/2007

(This spaco for State use only)

RECEIVED
APRM 2007(See Instructions on Reverse Side)

(5/2000)

OF0lbGAS&



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT

Utah State Office T^KE PRI DE^

P.O. Box 45155 "An RA

Salt Lake City,UT 84145-0155

IN REPLY REFER TO
3180
UT-922

April 23, 2007

Questar Exploration and Production Company
1050 17th Street, Suite 500
Denver, Colorado 80265

Re: Wonsits Valley Unit
Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

On April 12, 2007, we received an indenture dated April 6, 2007, whereby QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
resigned as Unit Operator and Questar Exploration and Production Company was designated as
Successor Unit Operator for the Wonsits Valley Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

This indenture was executed by all required parties and the signatory parties have complied with
Sections 5 and 6 of the unit agreement. The instrument is hereby approved effective April23, 2007.
In approving this designation, the Authorized Officer neither warrants nor certifies that the

designated party has obtained all required approval that would entitle itto conduct operations under
the Wonsits Valley UnitAgreement.

Your nationwide oil and gas bond No. ESBOOOO24willbe used to cover all federal operations within
the Wonsits Valley Unit.

It is requested that you notify all interested parties of the change in unit operator. Copies of the
approved instruments are being distributed to the appropriatefederal offices,withone copy returned
herewith.

Sincerely,

Is/ Greg J. Noble

Greg J. Noble
Acting Chief, Branch of Fluid Minerals

Enclosure
bcc: Field Mariager - Vernal (wlenclosure)

SITLA
Division of Oil, Gas & Mining
File - Wonsits Valley Unit (wlenclosure)
ARer ec. Chron RECENED
Central Files

UT922:TAThompson:tt:4/23/07

DROFOLGASS



STATE OF UTAH - FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASE DESIGNATIONAND SERIAL NUMBER:
UTU-0807

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6 FINDIAN LOTTEEORTRIBENAME:

7. UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wellsbelow current bottom-hole depth, reenterplugged wells, or t° WONSITS VALLEYUNITdrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form forsuch proposals.
1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER WV 16W-14-8-21
2. NAMEOFOPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

QUESTAR EXPLORATION& PRODUCTION CO. 4304734283
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WlLDCAT:
11002 E. 17500 S· CITY VERNAL STATE UT ZIP84078 (435) 781-4301 WONSITS VALLEY

4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESATSURFACE: 684' FSL 537' FEL COUNTY: UINTAH

QTR/QTR, SECTlON, TOWNSH1P, RANGE, MERIDIAN: SESE 14 8S 21E STATE:
UTAH

ii. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMAT10NNOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVlOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER:

O CONVERTWELLTYPE RECOMPLETE-DIFFERENTFORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Questar Exploration & Production Co. proposes to change the well name from WV 16W-14-8-21 to WV 16G-14-8-21.

NAME(PLEASEPRINT) Laura Bills TITLE Regulatory Affairs

SlGNATURE , DATE 11/1/2007

(This space for State use only)

RECElV
NOVO5 200T

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)

pg ycit,GAS&



STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES FORM 3

DIVISIONOF OIL, GAS, AND MINING
5. MINERALLEASE NO: . SURFACE:APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL UTU-0807 TRIBAL

1A. TYPE OF WORK: DRILÜ O REENTER Ü DEEPEN 7. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME

UTE TRIBE
B. TYPE OF WELL OIL GAS OTHER Ü SINGLEZONE 2 MULTIPLEZONE 8. UNITOf CA AGREEMENT NAME:

WONSITS VALLEY UNIT
2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:

QUESTAR EXPLORATION& PRODUCTION CO. WV 16g4-8-21
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDAND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

11002 E.17500 SO. CITY VERNAL STATE UT ZIP 84078 435-781-4301 WONSITSVALLEY gÑ
4. LOCATIONOF WELL (FOOTAGES) 11. QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE,
AT SURFACE: 684' FSL 537' FEL, SESE, SECTION 14, TSS, R21E MERIDIAN:
AT PROPOSED PRODUCING ZONE: 2200' FSL 1400' FEL, NWSE, SECTION 14, TSS, R21E SESE 14 8S 21E

14. DISTANCE IN MILESAND DIRECTION FROM NEAREST TOWN OR POST OFFICE: 12. COUNTY: 13. STATE:
11 + \ - MILES FROM OURAY, UTAH UINTAH UTAH

15. DISTANCETO NEAREST PROPERTY OR LEASE LINE(FEET) 16. NUMBEROF ACRES IN LEASE: 17. NUMBEROF ACRES ASSIGNED TO THIS WELL:
537' + I - 1280 40

18. DISTANCE TO NI¯ARESTWELL (DRILLING,COMPLETED, OR 19. PROPOSED DEPTH 20. BOND DESCRIPTION:
APPLIED FOR) ON THIS LEASE (FEET) 6,777' MD ESBOOOO24

21. ELEVATIONS(SHOW WHETHER DF, RT, GR,ETC.): 22. APPROXIMATEDATEWORK WILLSTART: 23. ESTIMATEDDURATION:
4,907' GL ASAP 20 DAYS

24 PROPOSED CASINGAND CEMENTINGPROGRAM
SIZE OF HOLE CASING SIZE, GRADE, AND WEIGHT PER FOOT SETTING DEPTH CEMENT TYPE, QUANTITY,YIELD,AND SLURRY WEIGHT

12 1/4" 9 5/8" K-55 36 lb/ft (new) ST&C 460' MD EXISTING
7 7/8" 5 1/2" J-55 15.5 lb/ft (new) LT&C 6,333" MD EXJSTING
4 3/4" 3 1/2" Flush J-55 9.2 lb/ft LT&C 6,77T MD SEE ATTACHED8-POINT DRILLINGPLAN

25 ATTACHMENT 4
VERIFY THE FOLLOWINGARE ATTACHEDINACCORDANCE WITH THE UTAHOILAND GAS CONSERATION GENERAL RULES:

WELLPLATOR MAPPREPAREDBYLICENSEDSURVEYOROR ENGINEER COMPLETEDRILLINGPLAN
O EVIDNECEOF DIVISIONOF WATERRIGHTSAPPROVALFOR USEOF WATER FORM5, IF OPERATORIS PERSONOR COMPANYOTHERTHANTHE LEASEOY

NAME (PULREEASEPRIN Laura s TDAT R1e1/ulatoryAffairs

(This space for State use only)

API NUMBERASSIGNED: 43-047-34283 APPROVAL:
Agoved by me

ah Mston g nuer•' '•"* CONFIDENTIAI.
(11/2001) 011,Gas and Mining acuana usessaary

(See Instruction on Reverse Side)



Additional Operator Remarks

Questar Exploration & Production Co. proposes to drill a re-entry well to 6,777' to test the Green
River. If productive, casing will be run and the well completed. If dry, the well will be plugged and
abandoned as per BLMand State of Utah requirement.

See Onshore Order No. 1 attached

Please be advised that Questar Exploration & Production Co. agrees to be responsible under the
terms and conditions of the lease for the operations conducted upon the lease lands.

Bond coverage for thiswell is provided by Bond No. ESBOOOO24. The principal is Questar
Exploration & Production Co. via surety as consent as provided for the 43 CFR 3104.2.

PLEASE FIND ATTACHED:

1. Re-Entry Procedure

2. Pathfinder Drilling Proposal

3. 8-point Program

4. Proposed Well Bore Diagram

5. Legal Plats / Map Prepared by UELS

6. Location Layout Refering to Reserve Pit

If additional Technical Information is required, Please contact Steve Hall,
Questar Petroleum Engineer at



QUESTAR EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION

WV 16G-14-8-21
API: 43-047-34283
Summarized Re-Entry Procedure

1. Rig down pumping unit, clear location of all unnecessary equipment.
2. MIRU pulling unit.
3. ND tubing head, NU BOP's (3M).
4. Kill well if necessary.
5. Pull out of hole with 213 rods (93 -

2/s" plain, & 120 - ¾" plain) and 2 ½" xl ¾"
x 16 x 19 x 20' RHAC pump.

6. Unseat tubing anchor and POOH with 173 jts 2 '/s"6.5# J-55 tubing, TAC, PSN,
T-Anchor.

7. PU bit and 5 ½" casing scraper, RIH to 5,500'.
8. Roll hole with KCl water, TOOH with bit and scraper.
9. RU wireline truck and RIH with CIBP.
10. Set top of CIBP @+/- 4,760', 28' above nearest collar @4,788'.
I1. ND BOP's
12. RD pulling unit, move off location.
13. MIRU drilling rig.
14. NU rig's 3,000 WP rated BOP.
15. RIH with whipstock, set and orient whipstock..
16. TIH with milling BHA, mill window in 5 ½" casing @4,748' top, 4,758' bottom.
17. TOOH, PU directional BHA, TIH.
18. Drill well at a 329.56° azimuth with 12.00°/100' build rates to land in Gl Lime

formation at a TVD of+/- 5,235'.
19. Drill +/- 1,285' of lateral in Gl Lime.

a. Mud system to be a KCl weighted water based mud, weights are expected to
be in the 8.8 - 9.5 ppg range.

20. Circulate and condition hole, TOOH, LD 1,746' DP.
a. PU slotted liner, blank liner and liner dropping tool.
b. RIH w/ liner and dropping tool, drop liner 2' outside window.
c. TOOH, LD remainder of DP.

21. RIH and set RBP @+/- 4,500' to isolate lateral.
22. ND BOP's.
23.



UESHR
Questar Exploration & Production
Uintah Co., UT
Sec.14-T8S-R21E
WV 16G-14-8-21
Wellbore #1

Plan: Plan #1

Pathfinder Planning Report
19 October, 2007

PAm?INDER
ENERGY



PathfindP arnnnng
e

oServices

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well WV16G-14-8-21
Company: Questar Exploration & Production TVD Reference: WELL @4920.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: Uintah Co., UT MD Reference: WELL @4920.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Sec.14-T8S-R21E North Reference: True
Weil: WV 16G-14-8-21 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
We11bore: Wellbore#1
Design: Plan #1

Project Uintah Co., UT

Map System: US State Plane 1983 System Datum: Mean Sea Level
Geo Datum: North American Datum 1983
Map zone: Utah Central Zone

Site Sec.14-TSS-R21E

Site Position: Northing: 7,218,007.8811 Latitude: 40° 7' 6.096 N
From: Lat/Long Easting: 2,195,998.3511 Longitude: 109° 30' 47.376 W
Position Uncertainty: 0.0 ft Slot Radius: " Grid Convergence: 1.27 °

Well WV 16G-14-8-21

Wen Position +NI-S 0.0 ft Northing: 7,218,007.88 ft Latitude: 40° 7' 6.096 N
+El-W 0.0 ft Easting: 2,195,998.35 11 Longitude: 109° 30' 47.376 W

Position Uncertainty 0.0 ft Wellhead Elevation: ft Ground Level: 4,907.0ft

Wellbore Wellbore #1

Magnetics Model Name Sample Date Declination Dip Angle Field Strength(*) (*) (nT)

IGRF200510 10/18/2007 11.56 66.06 52,778

Design Plan #1

Audit Notes:

Version: Phase: PROTOTYPE Tie On Depth: 0.0

VerticalSection: Depth From(TVD) +NI-S +E/-W Direction
(R) (ft) (fty (*)
0.0 0.0 0.0 329.56

Plan Sections

Measured Vertical Dogleg Build Turn
Depth inclination Azimuth Depth +NI-S +Ef-W Rate Rate Rate TFO

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (it) (°I100ft) (*I100R) (°I100It) (•) Target

0.0 0.00 0.00 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,757.8 0.00 0.00 4,757.8 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,491.1 88.00 329.56 5,235.0 397.3 -233.5 12.00 12.00 0.00 329.56
6,777.3 88.00 329.56 5,279.9 1,505.5 -884.7 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 PBHL WV 16G-14-8-

10/19/2007 11:08:05AM Page 2 COMPASS 2003.16



Pathfinderm nergy Services >ATRTINDER
ENERGYSERVICES

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well WV 16G-14-8-21
Company· Questar Exploration & Production TVD Reference: WELL @4920.011(Original Well Elev)
Project: Uintah Co., UT MD Reference: WELL @4920.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Sec.14-T8S-R21E North Reference: True
Well: WV 16G-14-8-21 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Wellbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Plan #1

Planned Survey

Measumd Vertical Vertical Dogleg Bulld Turn
Depth Incilnation Azimuth Depth +NI-S +El-W Section Rate Rate Rate

(R) (•) (•) (ft) (ft) (it) (ft) (°I100R) (*Ii00ft) (°IiCOR)

KOP I Start Build 12.00°

4,757.8 0.00 0.00 4,757.8 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
4,775.0 2.06 329.56 4,775.0 0.3 -0.2 0.3 12.00 12.00 0.00
4,800.0 5.06 329.56 4,799.9 1.6 -0.9 1.9 12.00 12.00 0.00
4,825.0 8.06 329.56 4,824.8 4.1 -2.4 4.7 12.00 12.00 0.00
4,850.0 11.06 329.56 4,849.4 7.7 -4.5 8.9 12.00 12.00 0.00
4,875.0 14.06 329.56 4,873.8 12.3 -7.3 14.3 12.00 12.00 0.00
4,900.0 17.06 329.56 4,897.9 18.1 -10.6 21.0 12.00 12.00 0.00
4,925.0 20.06 329.56 4,921.6 25.0 -14.7 29.0 12.00 12.00 0.00
4,950.0 23.06 329.56 4,944.9 32.9 -19.3 38.2 12.00 12.00 0.00
4,975.0 26.06 329.56 4,967.6 41.9 -24.6 48.6 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,000.0 29.06 329.56 4,989.7 51.8 -30.5 60.1 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,025.0 32.06 329.56 5,011.3 62.8 -36.9 72.8 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,050.0 35.06 329.56 5,032.1 74.7 -43.9 86.7 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,075.0 38.06 329.56 5,052.2 87.5 -51.4 101.5 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,100.0 41.06 329.56 5,071.4 101.3 -59.5 117.5 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,125.0 44.06 329.56 5,089.9 115.9 -68.1 134.4 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,150.0 47.06 329.56 5,107.4 131.2 -77.1 152.2 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,175.0 50.06 329.56 5,123.9 147.4 -86.6 171.0 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,200.0 53.06 329.56 5,139.4 164.3 -96.5 190.5 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,225.0 56.06 329.56 5,153.9 181.8 -106.9 210.9 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,250.0 59.06 329.56 5,167.3 200.0 -117.5 232.0 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,275.0 62.06 329.56 5,179.6 218.8 -128.6 253.8 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,300.0 65.06 329.56 5,190.8 238.1 -139.9 276.2 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,325.0 68.06 329.56 5,200.7 257.9 -151.5 299.1 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,350.0 71.06 329.56 5,209.4 278.1 -163.4 322.5 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,375.0 74.06 329.56 5,216.9 298.6 -175.5 346.4 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,400.0 77.06 329.56 5,223.1 319.5 -187.7 370.6 12.00 12.00 0.00

Gi Top Porosity
5,422.8 79.80 329.56 5,227.7 338.8 -199.1 392.9 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,425.0 80.06 329.56 5,228.1 340.6 -200.2 395.1 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,450.0 83.06 329.56 5,231.8 361.9 -212.7 419.8 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,475.0 86.06 329.56 5,234.1 383.4 -225.3 444.7 12.00 12.00 0.00

Start 1286.2 hold at 5491.1 MD
5,491.1 88.00 329.56 5,235.0 397.3 -233.5 460.8 12.00 12.00 0.00
5,500.0 88.00 329.56 5,235.3 404.9 -237.9 469.7 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,600.0 88.00 329.56 5,238.8 491.1 -288.6 569.6 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,700.0 88.00 329.56 5,242.3 577.3 -339.2 669.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,800.0 88.00 329.56 5,245.8 663.4 -389.8 769.5 0.00 0.00 0.00
5,900.0 88.00 329.56 5,249.2 749.6 -440.5 869.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,000.0 88.00 329.56 5,252.7 835.7 -491.1 969.4 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,100.0 88.00 329.56 5,256.2 921.9 -541.7 1,069.3 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,200.0 88.00 329.56 5,259.7 1,008.1 -592.4 1,169.2 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,300.0 88.00 329.56 5,263.2 1,094.2 -643.0 1,269.2 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,400.0 88.00 329.56 5,266.7 1,180.4 -693.6 1,369.1 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,500.0 88.00 329.56 5,270.2 1,266.6 -744.3 1,469.1 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,600.0 88.00 329.56 5,273.7 1,352.7 -794.9 1,569.0 0.00 0.00 0.00
6,700.0 88.00 329.56 5,277.2 1,438.9 -845.5 1,668.9 0.00 0.00 0.00

PBHL WV 16G-14-8-21
6,777.3 88.00 329.56 5,279.9 1,505.5 -884.7 1,746.2 0.00 0.00 0.00

10/19/2007 11:08:05AM Page 3 COMPASS 2003.16 BuHd



PathfindP arnnnng7e oServices

ENERGYSERVICES

Database: EDM 2003.16 Single User Db Local Co-ordinate Reference: Well WV 16G-14-8-21

Company: Questar Exploration & Production TVD Reference: WELL @4920.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Project: Uintah Co., UT MDReference: WELL @4920.0ft (Original Well Elev)
Site: Sec.14-TSS-R21E North Reference: True
Weli: WV 16G-14-8-21 Survey Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature
Weilbore: Wellbore #1
Design: Plan #1

Targels

Target Name
- hitimiss target Dfp Angle Dip Dir. TVD +NI•S +El-W Northing Easting
-Shape (•) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (it) (R) Latitude Longitude

PBHL WV 16G-14-8-21 0.00 0.00 5,279.9 1,505.5 -884.7 7,219,493.39 2,195,080.42 40° T 20.975 N 109° 30' 58.766 W
- plan hits target
- Point

Formations

Measured Vertical Dip
Depth Depth Dip Direction

(ft) (1t) Name Lithology (°) I I
2,240.0 2,240.0 Green River 2.00 329.56
5,422.8 5,214.0 G1 Top Porosity 2.00 329.56

5,220.0 G1 Lime Bottom Porosity 2.00 329.56
5,226.0 G1 Sand Top Porosity 2.00 329.56

Plan Annotations

Measured Vertical Local Coordinates
Depth Depth +NI-S +El-W

(it) (ft) (it) (it) Comment

4,757.8 4,757.8 0.0 0.0 KOP / Start Build 12.00°
5,491.1 5,235.0 397.3 -233.5 Start 1286.2 hold at 5491.1 MD
6,777.3 5,279.9 1,505.5 -884.7 TD at 6777.3

10/19/2007 11:08:05AM Page 4 COMPASS 2003.16 Build



Com n tar Ex Roration & Production

Wellbore #1 ENERGY SERVICESPlan: Plan #1 (WV 16G-14-8-21/Weilbore #1)

WELLDETAILS WV 16G-14-8-21 i i i

T
Ground Level 4907.0 M Azimuths to True North Sec.14-T8 S-R2 1E I+N/-S +El-W Northing Easting Latittude Longdude Slot MagneticNorth 1156

0.0 0.0 7218007 88 2195998.35 40° T 6.096 N 109° 30 47.376 W 2000- - - I - -
, , ,

_ Magnetic Field SHL 884' FSL & 537' FEL

WELLBORETARGET DETAILS(LATILONG) - Stre hA 77 Os0nT BHL 2200' FSL & 1400' FEL

Name TVD +Ni-S +El-W Latitude Longitude Shape Date 10/18/2007

PBHLWV 16G-14-8-21 52/9.9 1505 5 -884.7

40° 7' 20.975 N 109° 30' 58.766 W Point 1600 --- Model tGRF200510 - - PBHLWV 16G-14-8-2+

ANNOTATLONS
o 1200

TVD MD Annotation o .TDat 6777.3 I Start Build12.0tl
4400- 4757.8 4757.8 KOP / Starl Build 12.00 - - -

5235.0 5491.1 Start 12862 troidat 5491 1 MD
5279.9 6777.3 TDat 6777 3 +

4500- FORMAT10NTOP DETAILS Start 1286.2 hold atS491.1 MD
TVDPattMDPath FormatFon

G1 Lrrne Bottom Porosity 400
G1 Sand Top Porosity4600- 2240 0 2240.0 Green Rwer

5227 7 5422.8 G1 Top Poros.ty I i

Start Build12.0 0-
.c

|
.4700-

- i -400-

I
4aoo- - - |

-2400 -2000 -1600 -1200 -800 -400 0 400 800
- 4900- - - -

128&2 hold at 5491.1 D I
West(-)/East(+) (800 ftlin)

sooo-
I PBHLWV 16G-14-8-21 I -TDat 6777.3

- Gi Top Pomsity I
5100-

i

5200-

L
Gi Lime Bottom Poronty - - ¯- ¯ __¯ -

5300-
,

I

¯ G1 Sand Top Porosity

400 iii . ii li, iiii i i i ii i i i.i liii li i ii lii i ii i ii , iiii ii i.i. i.ii ii. ii

-230 -100 0 100 200 300 400 500 600 700 800 900 1000 1100 1200 1300 1400 1500 1600 1700 1800

Vertical Section at 329.56° (200



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO.
WV 16W-14-8-21 Re-Entry

DRILLING PROGRAM

ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
Approval of Operations on Onshore

Federal Oil and Gas Leases

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance is
made with applicable laws, regulations (43 CFR 3100), Onshore Oil & Gas No. 1, and the
approved plan of operations. The operator is fully responsible for the actions of its
subcontractors. A copy of these conditions will be furnished the field representative to insure
compliance.

1. Formation Tops

The estimated top of important geologic markers are as follows:

Formation Depth, TVD Depth, MD
Green River 2,240' 2,240'
Kick Off Point 4,758' 4,758'
Green River (Gl Lime) 5,235' 5,491'
TD 5,280' 6,777'

2. Anticipated Depths of Oil, Gas, Water, and Other Mineral Bearing Zones

The estimated depths at which the top an bottom of the anticipated water, oil, gas, or
other mineral bearing formations are expected to be encountered as follows:

Substance Formation Depth, TVD Depth, MD
Oil/Gas Green River (Gl Lime) 5,235' 5,491' - 6,777'

All fresh water and prospectively valuable minerals encountered during drilling will
be recorded by depth and adequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested
to determine commercial potential.

All water shows and water-bearing sands will be reported to the BLM in Vernal,
Utah. Copies of State of Utah form OGC-8-X are acceptable. If flows are detected,
samples will be submitted to the BLM along with any water analyses conducted.
Fresh water will be obtained from Wonsits Valley water right A36125 (which was
filed on May 7, 1964) or Red Wash water right # 49-2153 (which was filed on March
25, 1960). It was determined by the Fish and Wildlife Service that any water right
number filed before 1989 is not depleting to the Upper Colorado River System, to
supply fresh water for drilling purposes. All water resulting from drilling operations
will be disposed of at Red Wash Central Battery Disposal site; SWSE, Section 27,
T7S, R23E or Wonsits Valley Disposal Site; SWNW, Section 12, T8S, R21E.

Page 1 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO.
WV 16W-14-8-21 Re-Entry

3. Operator's Specification for Pressure Control Equipment

A. 3,000 psi double gate, 3,000 psi annular (schematic attached)

B. Function test daily.

C. All casing strings shall be pressure tested (0.22psi/ft or 1,500 psi, whichever
is greater) prior to drilling the plug after cementing; test pressure shall not
exceed the internal yield of the casing.

D. Ram type preventers and associated equipment shall be tested to rated
working pressure if isolated by a test plug or to 50% of the internal yield
pressure of casing, whichever is less. BOP and related equipment shall meet
the minimum requirements of Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 2 for equipment
and testing requirements, procedures, etc..., for a 3M system and individual
components shall be operable as designed.

4. Casing Program

As this well is a re-entry of an existing well the surface and production casing strings
are already in place as detailed below.

Hole Size Casing Size Depth, MD Weight Grade
12 ¼" 9 5/8" 460' 36.0 K-55
7 7/8" 5 ½" 6,333' 15.5 J-55

The lateral portion of this wellbore will be cased with a slotted line.

Hole Size Casing Size Top,MD Bottom, MD Weight Grade
4 3/4" 3 1/2" Flush 4,760' 6,777' 9.2 J-55

Please refer to the attached wellbore diagram and re-entry procedure for further
details.

5. Auxilliary Equipment

A. Kelly Cock - Yes

B. Float at the bit - No

C. Monitoring equipment on the mud system - visually and/or PVT or Flow
Show

D. Fully opening safety valve on the rig floor - Yes

E. Rotating Head - Yes

Page 2 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO.
WV 16W-14-8-21 Re-Entry

If drilling with air the following will be used:

F. The blooie line shall be at least 6" in diameter and extend at least 100' from
the wellbore into the reserve/blooie pit.

G. Blooie line ignition shall be provided by a continuous pilot (ignited when
drilling below 500')

H. Compressor shall be tied directly to the blooie line through a manifold

I. A mister with a continuous stream of water shall be installed near the end of
the blooie lines for dust suppression.

Drilling of the lateral will be done with fresh water KCl based mud systems
consisting primarily of fresh water, bentonite, lignite, caustic, lime, soda ash,
polymers, and KCl. No chromates will be used. It is not intended to use oil in the
mud, however, in the event it is used the concentration will be less than 4% by
volume. Maximum anticipated mud weight is 9.5 ppg.

No minimum quantity of weight material will be required to be kept on location.

PVT/Flow show will be used upon exit of existing production casing to TD.

Gas detector will be used upon exit of existing production casing to TD.

6. Testing, Logging, and Coring Program

A. Cores - None Anticipated

B. DST - None Anticipated

C. Logging:
i. Mud logging from casing exit to TD

ii. MWD-GR will be utilized during drilling operations to aid in landing
the curve and maintaining the lateral within the desired zone.

D. Formation and completion interval: Gl Lime interval, final determination of
completion will be made by analysis of mud logging data. Stimulation:
stimulation will be designed for the particular area of interest encountered.

Page 3 of



ONSHORE OIL & GAS ORDER NO. 1
QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO.
WV 16W-14-8-21 Re-Entry

7. Cementing Program

As this is a re-entry well and a slotted liner will be run in the newly drilled lateral
there will be no cement required to drill this well. Please refer to the attached
wellbore diagram for existing casing and cement conditions.

8. Anticipated Abnormal Pressures and Temperatures, Other Potential Hazards

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2S has been
encountered or is known to exist from previous wells drilled to similar depths in the
general area. Maximum anticipated bottom-hole pressure equals approximately 2,610
psi. Maximum anticipated bottom hole temperature is approximately 150°F.

Page 4 of



QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.

DRILLING PROGRAM
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WV16W-14·8-21

12 1/4" hole
9-5/8", 36#, K-55
casing set @460'

Top of cement @900'

Top of window @4,748'

Whipstock
12.0° Dogleg

CIBP set @4,758' -+

Perfs 5,22T - 5,232' - - 1,746' of 4-3/4" lateral hole w/ 3" slotted &blank liner

7 7/8" hole i

PBTD @6,55T5-1/2", 15.5#, J-55
casing set @6,333'

TD



Completion Start Date: 03/22/02
FIELD: Wonsits Valley GL: 4907 KBE: 4920 Spud Date: 03/01/02 Finsh Date: 05/03/2002

WELLNAME: WV 16W-14-8-21 TD: 7700 PBTE #### Current Well Status: Shut In 7/1/04
Location: SESE Sec 14, TSS, R21E APl#: 43-047-34283 Reason for PullIWorkover:

Completion of Well.
Uintah County, Utah

Weubore
Schematic Tubing Landing Detail:

Description Size Footage DepthSurface casing
Size 9 5/8" KB 0.00
Weight 36.0# Stretch
Grade K-55 164 jts 2 7/8"
Cemented T anchor 5112.00
WI 175 SXS 8 jts 2 7/8"
Hole size 12 1/4" PSN 5360.00

Set @ 460' 1 Jt 2 7/8" 5390.00

TOC @' 900 EOT 5390.00
Tubing information

EXCLUDED PERFS OPEN PERFS Condition:
New: X Used: Rerun:
Grade: J-55
Weight (#lft):6.5#
Sucker Rod Detail:
Number #Rods Details
3/4" 120 Plain
7/8" 93 Plain
pulled rods and pump 7/1/04

Rod Information
Condition:
New: X USED RERUN
Grade: D'
Manufacture:

Pump Information:
API Designation

Example:
Pump SN#: Original Run Date:
RERUN NEW RUN

ESP Well Flowing Well
Cable Size: "R" NIPPLE

Anchor @5112' Pump Intake @ ' PKR @
End of Pump @ ' EOT @
Wellhead Detail:

. 5227'-5232' G1 7 1/16" 2000#
7 1/16" 3000#
7 1/16" 5000#
Other:
Landed on: Hanger Bonnet

SN @5360' SUMMARY
InitialCompletion 03/22/2002- 05/03/2002

EOT @5390 RIHandtagPB@6238'.Perfsqueezeholes@5370'and5150'.Sqzw/175sxs,drilloutand
nohold.Re-squeezewith225sxs,drilloutandnotholdingbutbetter.Swableakingsqueeze
perfs@10%cilcut.PerfG15227'-5232'.Swabat FER=???BPH@ 5%oilcut.RIHw/
productiontubing.TWOTP.
DateofFirstProduction= 05/04/2002
IPP= 22B0PD,OMcfPD,321BWPDon05/15/2002

7/1/04 Pulled and layed down rods and pump

Production casing
Size 5 1/2"
Weight 15.5#
Grade J-55

Cemented
W/ SXS PBTD @6557'
Set @ 6333'
Hole size 7 7 /8" TD @6600'

i I

Prepared By: jtc Date:



Lessee's or Operator's Representative:

Jan Nelson
Red Wash Rep.

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc.
11002 East 17500 South

Vernal, Utah 84078
(435) 781-4331

Certification:

All lease and/or unitoperations will be conducted in such a manner that full compliance
is made withall applicable laws, regulations, Onshore Oil & Gas Orders, the approved

plan of operations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.

QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. will be fully responsible for the actions of theirsubcontractors.

A complete copy of the approved Application for Permit to Drillwill be furnished to the
field representative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on location during all

construction and drilling operations.

I hereby certifythat I, or persons under my direct supervision, have inspected the
proposed drill site and access route; that I am familiar with the conditions which currently

exist; that the statements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge, trueand
correct; and that the work associated with the operations proposed herein will be

performed by QEP Uinta Basin, Inc. its' contractors and subcontractors in conformity
with thisplan and the terms and conditions under which it is approved. This statement is

subject to the provisions of 18 U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

01-Nov-07
Jan Nelson Date

Red Wash



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
TBS, R21E, S. L.B. &M. Well location, WV #16G-14-8-21, located as .

shown in the SE 1/4 SE 1/4 of Section 14,
T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. Uintoh County, Utah.

SB929'OS"W - 2658.70' (Meas.) SO928'01"W - 2640.06' (Meas.)
Brass Cap Brass Cap Brass ¢ap

BASIS OF ELEVATION
BENCH MARK (45 EAM) LOCATED IN THE N 1/2 OF SECTION
5, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M. TAKEN FROMTHE BRENNAN BASIN
QUADRANGLE,UTAH,UINTAH COUNTY7.5 MINUTE QUAD.
(TOPOGRAPHIC MAP) PUBLISHED BY THE UNITED STATES
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR, GEOLOGICALSURVEY. SAID
ELEVATIONIS MARKED AS BEING 4689 FEET.

N

Brass Cap Oross Cap

SCALE

CERTI ;
THIS IS TO CERTIFYTHAT ARED FROMb FIELD NOTES OF ACTUAL S E BY ER MY
SUPERVISIONAND THAT UE A CT TO THE
BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE LIE gg

WV /16G-14-8-21
E/ev. Ungraded Ground = 4910'

IS ND R R
ATION , 16

Brass Cap Brass Cap REVISED: 10-11-07 S.L. ¿t
SB921'14"W - 2668.75' (Meas.)

' '
SB920'J7"W - 2672.90' (Meas.) Bro2s cop NAH &GINEERING & SJRVEYING

85 SOUTH 200 EAST - VERNAL, UTAH 84078NAD 27 (SCALED)
(435) 789-1017LEGEND: LATlTUDE = 40°07'06"

SCALE DATE SURVEYED: DATE DRAWN:\ ,,. ,, . LONGITUDE= 109°30'48" 1" = 1000' 8-6-01 8-14-01= 9v aYMBOL

PARTY REFERENCES= PROPOSEDWELL HEAD. BASIS OF BEARINGS IS THE EAST LINE OF THE NE 1/4 Ð.A. J.A. D.R.B. G.L.O. PLATOF SECTION 13, TSS, R21E, S.L.B.&M.WHICHIS ASSUMED WEATHER FILE= SECTIONCORNERSLOCATED' FROMG.L.O. INFORMATIONTO BEARNOO'49'W. WARM QUESTAREXPLR. &



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD.
FIGURE #iLOCATION LAYOUTFOR

WV #16G-14--8-21
voiling SECTION 14, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.È 4. 684' FSL 537' FEL

de s Proposed Access E-5.2'
E/. 909.8' E/. 90 2' Road gy ppy gr

8
us a. J+25as' EYOR

SCALE: 1" = 50'
DATE: 08-15-01 Round Corner
Drawn By· D.R.B. as Needed 2

REVISED: 10-11-07 S.L.

Approx.
Top of
Cut Slope

Approx.
Toe of
Fill Slope

NOTE
Flore Pit is to be /ocated PIPE TUBS
a min. of 100' from the i I I I
We// Head.

PIPE RACKS

(bitn. pi
70' o as 135' Sta. 1+50

TOILET E-5.8'
ESERVE P/TS \ vm E/. 901.2'

(s' o..p) \ wm
LIGHT PLANT

- to -- o

PUMP HOUS

BOCO

PRES OR WAATER

BOOSTER
Total Pit CopacityO- 4 W/2' of Freeboard

- = 7800 Bb/s. ± TR SH Sta. O 50
Total Pit Volurne "O

= 2, J40 Cu. Yds. L

E/. 912.8
35 S 0+00

et'P 4 '

E/. 913.6'

NO TES:
E/ev. Ungraded Ground At Loc. Sta/<e = 4909.5'

, UINTAH ENGINEERING & LAND SURVEYINGF/N/SHED GRADEELEV AT LOC. STAKE = 4907.0 es so. zoo se., • v.mat. ve.» esore • (vas;



QUESTAR EXPLR. & PROD. FIGURE fj2
. TYPICAL CROSS SECTIONS FORX-Section

scale WV #16G-14-8-21
SECTION14, T8S, R21E, S.L.B.&M.1" = 50' EY *684' FSL 537' FEL

DATE: 08-15-01
Drawn By D.R.B.

REVISED: 10-11-07 S.L. 35 135 p'

Einished Grade

STA. J+25

1O' 35' 135'

---

Location Stoke

10' 70 35' 135'
S/ope = 1 1/2. 1

Preconstruction 35' 135'
Grade

CUT

STA. 0+00

APPROXIMATEYARDAGES EXCESS MATERIALAFTER
5% COMPACTION = 3,690 Cu. Yds.

CUT Topsoil & Pit Backfill = 3,690 Cu. Yds.
(12") Topsoil Stripping = 2,520 Cu. Yds· (1/2 Pit Vol.)
Remaining Location = 6,730 Cu. Yds. EXCESS UNBALANCE = 0 Cu. Yds.

TOTAL CUT = 9,250 CU.YDS. (After Rehabilitation)

FILL = 5,280 CU.YDS. IIINTAH ENGINEERING a· LAND SURVEYING
86 So. ß00 Best * Vernal, Utah 84078 * (436)
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United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Utah State Office

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, Utah 84145-0155

IN FŒPLY REFER TO:
3160
(UT-922)

November 19, 2007

Memorandum

To: Assistant District Manager Minerals, Vernal District

From: Michael Coulthard, Petroleum Engineer

Subject: 2007 Plan of Development Wonsits Valley Unit
Uintah County, Utah.

Pursuant to email between Diana Whitney, Division of Oil, Gas and
Mining, and Mickey Coulthard, Utah State Office, Bureau of Land
Management, the following well (formally 16W-14-8-21) will be re-
entered and completed horizontally in the Green River formation.
The work is planned for calendar year 2007 within the Wonsits
Valley Unit, Uintah County, Utah.

API# WELLNAME LOCATION

(Proposed PZ Green River)

43-047-34283 WV 16G-14-8-21 Sec 14 TO8S R21E 0684 FSL 0537 FEL
BHL Sec 14 TOBS R21E 2200 FSL 1400 FEL

This office has no objection to permitting the well at this time.

/s/ Michael L. Coulthard

bcc: File - Wonsits Valley Unit
Division of Oil Gas and Mining
Central Files
Agr. Sec. Chron
Fluid Chron



State AUtah $
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

MICHAELR.STYLER
ExecutiveDirector

JON M. HUNTSMAN, JR.
Division of Oil Gas and Mining

Governor JOHN R. BAZA

GARY R.HERBERT
Division Director

Lieutenant Governor

November 19, 2007

QuestarExploration & Production
l 1002 E 17500 S
Vernal, UT 84078

Re: WV 16G-14-8-21 Well, Surface Location 684' FSL, 537' FEL, SE SE, Sec. 14,
T. 8 South, R. 21 East, Bottom Location 2200' FSL, 1400' FEL, NW SE, Sec. 142
T. 8 South, R. 21 East, Uintah County, Utah

Gentlemen:

Pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Utah Code Ann.§ 40-6-1 et seq., Utah
Administrative Code R649-3-1 et seq., and the attached Conditions of Approval, approval to drill
the referenced well is granted.

This approval shall expire one year from the above date unless substantial and continuous
operation is underway, or a request for extension is made prior to the expiration date. The API
identification number assigned to this well is 43-047-34283.

Sjncerely,

, Gil Himt
Associate Director

pab
Enclosures

cc: Uintah County Assessor
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal Office

UTAH

DNR

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone (801) 538-5340 • facsimile (801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 • wwwogm.utah.gov OIL, GAS &



O O
Operator: QuestarExploration & Production
Well Name & Number WV 16G-14-8-21

API Number: 43-047-34283
Lease: UTU-0807

Surface Location: SE SE Sec. 14 T. 8 South R. 21 East
Bottom Location: NW SE Sec. 14 T. 8 South R. 21 East

Conditions of Approval

1. General
Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., the Oil and Gas
Conservation General Rules, and the applicable terms and provisions of the approved
Application for permit to drill.

2. Notification Requirements
Notify the Division within 24 hours of spudding the well.
• Contact Carol Daniels at (801) 538-5284

Notify the Division prior to commencing operations to plug and abandon the well.
• Contact Dustin Doucet at (801) 538-5281 (801) 733-0983 home

3. Reporting Requirements
All required reports, forms and submittals will be promptly filed with the Division,
including but not limited to the Entity Action Form (Form 6), Report of Water
Encountered During Drilling (Form 7), Weekly Progress Reports for drilling and
completion operations, and Sundry Notices and Reports on Wells requesting approval of
change of plans or other operational actions.

4. State approval of this well does not supersede the required federal approval, which must be
obtained prior to



Form 3160-4 Form approved.
(November 1983) UNITED STATES SUBMIT IN DUPLICATE Budget Bureau No. 1004-0137

(fc.rmerly9-330) DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR (Seeotherin- ExpiresAugust31, 1985
BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMEN structionson

00NFllEN11ALreverseside). 5. LEASEDESIGNATION SERIALNO.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTIEE OR TRIBE NAME
WELL COMPLETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORT AND LOG * UTE TRIBE

la. TYPE OF WELL OIL GAS 7. UNTTAGREEMENTNAME
WELL WELL DRY Other WONSITS VALLEY UNIT

b TYPE OF COMPLETION

NEW WORK DEEP- PLUG DIFF. 8. FARM OR LEASE NAME
WELL OVER EN BACK RESVR Other lšEBOMBI:HION- N/A

LATERAL WELL
2. NAME OF OPERATUR 9 WELL NO.

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. WV 16G 14 8 21

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR. DAHN CALDWELL 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT
11002 E. 17500 S. VERNAL, UT 84078-8526 435-781-4342

4. LOCATION OF WELL (Report location clearly andin accordance with any State requirements)* WON SITS VALLEY

At surface 684' FSL, 537' FEL, SESE, SEC 14-TSS-R21E (SURFACE) 11. SEC.,T., R., M.,OR BLOCK AND SURVEY
OR AREA

At top rod, interval reported below SEC 14-T8S-R21E

At total depth 2200' FSL, 1400' FEL, NWSE, SEC 14-T8S-R21E (BOTTOM)
..v 14 PERMITNO. DATEISSUED 12. COUNTYOR 13. STATE43'79 FSL /Vyx FEZ PARISH

43-047-34283 UINTAH UTAH
15. DATE SPUDDED 16 DATE T.D. REACHED 17. DATE COMPL. (Ready to prod) 18. ELEVATIONS (DF, RKB, RT, GR, ETC.)* 19. ELEV. CASINGHEAD

4/11/08 4/26/08 5/28/08 KB
20. TOTALDEPTH, MD & TVD 21. PLUG BACK T.D., MD & TVD 22. IF MULTIPLECOMPL., 23, INTERVALS ROTARY TOOLS CABLE TOOLS//}/) HOW MANY* DRILLED BY

7000' mu N/A ---> X
24. PRODUCING INTERVAL(S), OF TH[S COMPLETÏON-TOP, BOTTOM,NAME (MD AND TVD)* 25. WAS DIRECTIONAL

SURVEY MADE
GREEN RIVER
OPEN HOLE

YES

26. TYPE ELECTRIC AND OTHER LOGS RUN 27. WAS WELL CORED
NO LOGS RUN NO

28. CASING RECORD (Report aR strings set in wek)
CASING SlZE WEIGHT, LB./FT. DEPTH SET(MD) HOLE SI2E CEMENTING RECORD AMOUNT PULLED

29. LINER RECORD 30. TUBINGRECORD
SIZE TOP (MD) BOTIOM (MD) SACKS CEMENT* SCREEN (MD) SIZE DEPTH SET (MD) PACKER SET (MD)

31. PERFORATION RECORD (Interm( size and number) 32. AClD, SHOT, FRACTURE, CEMENT SQUEEZE,EIC.
DEPTlf INTERVAL (MD) AMOUNT AND KIND OF MATERIAL USED

Green River G-1 Lime Acidize w/ 3000 gals of 15% HCL
Top of Liner @4638' 6866'
Casing Window 4750' - 4762' 6557' Acidize w/ 3000 gals of 15% HCL
3-1/2", 9.3#, P-110 4638' to 7000' (4-3/4" Open Window) 5935' Acidize w/3000 gals of 15% HCL

33.* PRJDUCTION
DATE FIRST PRODUCTION PRODUCTION METHOD (Flowing,gas hyt,pumping-,size and type ofpump) WELL STATUS (Producing or

shut-in)
5/28/08 Pumping Producing

DATE OF TEST HOURS TESTED CHOKE SIZE PROD'N FOR OIL-BBL GAS-MCF WATER-BBL. GAS-OIL RATIO
TEST PERIOD

5/31/08 24 N/A ----> 11 0 304
FLOW. TUBINGPRESS. CASING PRESSURE CALCULATED OIL-BBL. GAS-MCF WATEROBL OIL GRAVITY-API (CORR.)

24-HOUR RATE
150 40 >

34. DISNSITION OF GAS (Sold, usedfor fuel, vented, etc) R$6E1TEIFJNHOE
35. LISTOF ATIACHMENTS

SUBSEQUENT SUMMARY FOR THIS WELL
36. I hereby certify thatthe foregoing and attached nnation is co te and correct as determin v able records

SIGNED JIMSIMONTON \. ps. COMPLETIONSUPERVI y (g( M¡M¡Me
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'°"'" UNITED STATES FORMAPPROVED

>="e '99 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR Budget Bureau No. 1004-0135

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT aposmarciamm

5 Lease Designation and Serial No.

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS UTU-0807

Do not use this formfor proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir
Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT--" for such proposals 5 Ifladian,AllotteeorTribeName

UTE TRIBE

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICA Œ 7 If Unit or CA, Agreement Designation

i Type of We0 WONSITS VALLEY UNIT
Oil Gas

O ** U "" O Other 3 Well Name and No.

WV 16G l4 8 2l
2 NameofOperator

QUESTAR EXPLORATION & PRODUCTION CO. 9 APIWeHNo.

3
AddressandTelephoneNo. Contact: dahn.caldwell@questar.com 43- 47-34283

11002 East 17500 South - Vernal, UT 84078 435.781.4342 Fax 435.781.4357 10. Fiefdand Pool, orExploratory Area

4 Location of Well (Footage, Sec, T., R., M., or Survey Description) WONSITS VALLEY
SURFACE: 684' FSL, 537' FEL, SESE, SEC 14-T8S-R21E 11. countyor Parish, State
BOTTOM: 2200' FSL, 1400' FEL, NWSE, SEC 14-T8S-R21E

UINTAH, UT

12 CHECK APPROPRIATE B 3X(s) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, 3R OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O Notice of Intent Abandonment Change of Plans

Recompletion New Constmction

Subsequent Report Plugging Back Non-Routine Fracturing

O CasingR WaterShutOff

O Final Abandonment Notice Ah Cmiœ tw

Other LATERAL W= WM

(Note) Report results of multiple completion on Well
Completion or Recompletion Regott and Log form.)

13. Describe Proposed or Completed Operations (Clearly state all pettinent details, and give pertinent dates, includingestimated date of starting any proposed work. If well is directionally drilled,
give subsurface locations and measured and true vertical depths for all markers and zones pertinent to this work)

This well sundry was created for the purpose to report the work that was completed on the Lateral Completion/Recompletion.
1- On 4/11/08 - Drilling - Top of window @4,749' down 6' to 4,755'.
2- Horizontal Ieg drilled to 7000' MD.
3- On 5/15/08 MIRU Rocky Mtn WS.
4- MIRU Halliburton to acid G-1 Lime in (3) separate stages using 3,000 gals of 15% HCL acid w/ tbg settings at 6866';

6557' & 5935'.
5- Set tbg tail @4608'. Run rods & pump & placed on production on 5/28/08.

14. I hereby certifythat the foregoing is true and ect.
Signed Jim Simonton ( ( y Completion Supervisor oa'° 8/19/08

(This space for Federal or State office use)

Approved bo

approval, ifany

Title Date

SEPO8 2008
D1V.0FOIL,GAS&



Questar E & P Page 1 of 3

Deviation Summary
Well Name: WV 16G-14-8-21 Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 s/T # v.s.Azi (°)
TMD: 6,959.0 (ft) TVD: 5,284.44 (ft) Spud Date: 3/1/2002 OH 0.00Closure Distance: 1,925.7 (ft) Closure Direction: 331.62 (°) Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature 01 _ 329,56

S/T # TMD Angle Azimuth CTM TVD N/-S El-W Vert. Section DLS BUR Type
(ft) (°) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°/100ft) (°/100ft)

01 4,700.0 2.18 160.25 NYN 4,698.22 0.00 . 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 GMS
01 4,822.0 10.00 10.34 YNN 4,819.69 8.27 2.70 5.76 9.78 6.41 MWD
01 4,853.0 16.79 9.02 YNN 4,849.83 15,34 3.88 11.26 21.92 21.90 MWD
01 4,885.0 22.85 9.67 YNN 4,879.92 26.04 5.65 19.59 18.95 18.94 MWD
01 4,916.0 24.15 8.57 YNN 4,908.35 38.25 7.61 29.12 4.43 4.19 MWD
01 4,947.0 25,62 4.07 YNN 4,936.47 51.21 9.03 39.57 7.73 4.74 MWD
01 4,978.0 27.36 356.61 YNN 4,964.22 65.01 9.08 51.45 12.10 5.61 MWD
01 5,010.0 29.81 348.14 YNN 4,992.33 80.14 7.01 65.54 14.78 7.66 MWD
01 5,042.0 32.69 339.62 YNN 5,019.70 96.04 2.36 81.60 16.47 9.00 MWD
01 5,073.0 36.08 334.95 YNN 5,045.28 112.16 -4.42 98.94 13.85 10.94 MWD
01 5,103.0 38.15 327.60 YNN 5,069.22 128.00 -13.13 117.01 16.30 6.90 MWD
01 5,134.0 41.64 325.57 YNN 5,093.00 144.58 -24.09 136.86 12.01 11.26 MWD
01 5,166.0 44.81 328.17 YNN 5,116.31 162.94 -36.05 158.74 11.36 9.91 MWD
01 5,197.0 50.55 329.70 YNN 5,137.18 182.57 -47.86 181.65 18.87 18.52 MWD
01 5,229.0 57.94 327.81 YNN 5,155.86 204.74 -61.33 207.60 23.58 23.09 MWD
01 5,263.0 65.75 331.86 YNN 5,171.90 230.65 -76.35 237.54 25.25 22.97 MWD
01 5,295.0 69.71 332.80 YNN 5,184.02 256.88 -90.09 267.11 12.67 12.38 MWD
01 5,326.0 71.25 333.35 YNN 5,194.38 282.93 -103.32 296.28 5.24 4.97 MWD
01 5,358.0 74.48 333,21 YNN 5,203.81 310.24 -117.07 326.79 10.10 10.09 MWD
01 5,390.0 80.28 332.22 YNN 5,210.80 337.98 -131.38 357.95 18.37 18.13 MWD
01 5,421.0 84.34 332.28 YNN 5,214.95 365.16 -145.68 388.63 13.10 13.10 MWD
01 5,452.0 84.35 331.88 YNN 5,218.00 392.42 -160.13 419.45 1.28 0.03 MWD
01 5,485.0 85.20 330.89 YNN 5,221.01 421.26 -175.87 452.30 3.94 2.58 MWD
01 5,515.0 85.50 330.66 YNN 5,223.44 447,36 -190.47 482.19 1.26 1.00 MWD
01 5,547.0 85.66 330.39 YNN 5,225.90 475.13 -206.17 514.09 0.98 0.50 MWD
01 5,578.0 88.32 330.40 YNN 5,227.53 502.05 -221.46 545.04 8.58 8.58 MWD
01 5,609.0 88.92 330.54 YNN 5,228.28 529.01 -236.73 576.03 1.99 1.94 MWD
01 5,641.0 89.80 330.70 YNN 5,228.64 556.90 -252.43 608.02 2.80 2.75 MWD
01 5,672.0 88.22 330.20 YNN 5,229.17 583.86 -267.72 639.01 5.35 -5.10 MWD
01 5,703.0 86.54 329.55 YNN 5,230.59 610.64 -283.26 669.98 5.81 -5.42 MWD
01 5,733.0 86.87 329.68 YNN 5,232.31 636.48 -298.41 699.93 1.18 1.10 MWD
01 5,765.0 86.91 329.09 YNN 5,234.05 663.98 -314.68 731.68 1.85 0.13 MWD
01 5,796.0 86.94 329.38 YNN 5,235.71 690.58 -330.51 762.84 0.94 0.10 MWD

Printed: 9/4/2008 8:35:57



Questar E & P Page 2 of 3

Deviation Summary
Well Name: WV 16G-14-8-21 Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 s/T # v.s. Azi (°)
TMD: 6,959.0 (ft) TVD: 5,284.44 (ft) Spud Date: 3/1/2002 oH o.ooClosure Distance: 1,925.7 (ft) Closure Direction: 331.62 (°) Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature og 429,se
S/T # TMD Angle A21muth CTM TVD N/-S E/-W Vert. Section DLS BUR Type

(ft) (*) (°) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°/100ft) (°/100ft)

01 5,827.0 86.94 329.26 YNN 5,237.37 717.20 -346.31 793.79 0.39 0.00 MWD
01 5,861.0 87.01 329.55 YNN 5,239.16 746.43 -363.59 827.75 0.88 0.21 MWD
01 5,890.0 86.04 329.18 YNN 5,240.92 771.33 -378.34 856.69 3.58 -3.34 MWD
01 5,922.0 84.58 329.75 YNN 5,243.53 798.80 -394.54 888.58 4.90 -4.56 MWD
01 5,953.0 84.44 329.55 YNN 5,246.50 825.43 -410.13 919.44 0.79 -0.45 MWD
01 5,985.0 86.40 329.69 YNN 5,249.06 852.95 -426.26 951.34 6.14 6.13 MWD
01 6,015.0 87.05 329.45 YNN 5,250.77 878.77 -441.43 981.29 2.31 2.17 MWD
01 6,047.0 88.86 330.00 YNN 5,251.91 906.39 -457.56 1,013.27 5.91 5.66 MWD
01 6,078.0 89.80 329.85 YNN 5,252.27 933.21 -473.09 1,044.26 3.07 3.03 MWD
01 6,110.0 88.89 329.19 YNN 5,252.64 960.79 -489.32 1,076.26 3.51 -2.84 MWD
01 6,141.0 89.23 329.12 YNN 5,253.15 987.40 -505.21 1,107.26 1.12 1.10 MWD
01 6,172.0 89.13 328.97 YNN 5,253,59 1,013.98 -521.16 1,138.25 0.58 -0.32 MWD
01 6,204.0 88.39 329.51 YNN 5,254.28 1,041.47 -537.52 1,170.24 2.86 -2.31 MWD
01 6,236.0 87.41 330.30 YNN 5,255.46 1,069.14 -553.55 1,202.22 3.93 -3.06 MWD
01 6,267.0 86.87 330.67 YNN 5,257.00 1,096.08 -568.81 1,233.18 2.11 -1.74 MWD
01 6,298.0 86.33 330.36 YNN 5,258.84 1,123.02 -584.04 1,264.12 2.01 -1.74 MWD
01 6,331.0 86.91 330.71 YNN 5,260.79 1,151.70 -600.24 1,297.06 2.05 1.76 MWD
01 6,362.0 87.68 330.68 YNN 5,262.25 1,178.70 -615.40 1,328.01 2.49 2.48 MWD
01 6,393.0 88.45 331.59 YNN 5,263.30 1,205.84 -630.35 1,358.98 3.84 2.48 MWD
01 6,426.0 88.22 331.44 YNN 5,264.26 1,234.83 -646.09 1,391.95 0.83 -0.70 MWD
01 6,456.0 88.22 331.11 YNN 5,265.19 1,261.13 -660.50 1,421.92 1.10 0.00 MWD
01 6,487.0 87.68 331.11 YNN 5,266.30 1,288.25 -675.46 1,452.89 1.74 -1.74 MWD
01 6,519.0 86.88 330.39 YNN 5,267.82 1,316.14 -691.08 1,484.85 3.36 -2.50 MWD
01 6,551.0 87.41 330.59 YNN 5,269.41 1,343.95 -706.83 1,516.80 1.77 1.66 MWD
01 6,583.0 87.92 331.02 YNN 5,270.71 1,371.86 -722.42 1,548.77 2.08 1.59 MWD
01 6,615.0 87.92 330.27 YNN 5,271.87 1,399.74 -738.10 1,580.74 2.34 0.00 MWD
01 6,646.0 87.75 330.58 YNN 5,273.05 1,426.68 -753.39 1,611.72 1.14 -0.55 MWD
01 6,678.0 87.55 329.63 YNN 5,274.36 1,454.40 -769.32 1,643.69 3.03 -0.63 MWD
01 6,742.0 86.74 328.60 YNN 5,277.55 1,509.25 -802.13 1,707.61 2.05 -1.27 MWD
01 6,773.0 87.44 328.41 YNN 5,279.12 1,535.65 -818.31 1,738.56 2.34 2.26 MWD
01 6,804.0 87.45 327.93 YNN 5,280.50 1,561.96 -834.64 1,769.52 1.55 0.03 MWD
01 6,866.0 88.96 328.80 YNN 5,282.44 1,614.72 -867.14 1,831.47 2.81 2.44 MWD
01 6,929.0 88.52 328.53 YNN 5,283.83 1,668.52 -899.90 1,894.45 0.82 -0.70 MWD

Printed: 9/4/2008 8:35:57



Questar E &P Page 3 of 3

Deviation Summary
Well Name: WV 16G-14-8-21 Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 s/T # v.s.Azi (°)
TMD: 6,959.0 (ft) TVD:5,284.44 (ft) Spud Date: 3/1/2002 oH 0.00Closure Distance: 1,925.7 (ft) Closure Direction: 331.62 (°) Calculation Method: Minimum Curvature 01 329.56
S/T # TMD Angle Azimuth CTM TVD N/-S E/-W Vert. Section DLS BUR Type

(ft) (*) (*) (ft) (ft) (ft) (ft) (°l100ft) (°l100ft)
01 6,959.0 89.13 329.31 YNN 5,284.44 1,694.21 -915.38 1,924.44 3.30 2.03 MWD

Printed: 9/4/2008 8:35:57



Questar E & P Page 1 of 1

Operations Summary Report - EE p
Well Name: WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 4/28/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 72

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

4/9/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 Tight Hole (Horizontal) - Prepare well for drilling rig.
On 4/8/08 MIRU Basin Well Service. Pump 100 bbis of production water down the tbg
with hot oiler. NDWH. NU BOP's. Release tbg anchor set @5112'. POOH wl 164
jts of 2-7/8" 6.5#tbg wl no anchor or BHA leaving tbg anchor, 6 jts of tbg, SN & 1 jt of
tbg in hole. RIH w/ 4-3/4" bit & 5-1/2" csg scraper and tbg to 4900'. SIFN.

24 Hour forecast: Will hot oil well and pull tbgand RIH w/ CIBP on tbg and set and pull
and lay down tbg and RDMO Basin Well Service.

Csg Depth: 5-1/2" 15.5# J-55
4/1 1/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 2 Tight Hole (Horizontal) - Prepare well for drilling rig.

On 4/9/08 - No pressure on the well. Heat well with 130 bbis of 2% KCL water. POOH
w/ bit & scraper. RIH on tbg with a 5-1/2" CIBP and set @4760', Test plug and csg to
500#and held OK. POOH and lay down 154 jts of 2-7/8" tbg. ND BOP's and NU
WH. RDMO Basin Well Service. Basin willbe on standby on 4/10/08. No further
reports this week. Location &wellbore are ready for drilling rig.

Csg Depth: 5-1/2" 15.5# J-55

I
i

Þrinted: 9/4/2008 8:36:39
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Operations Summary Report L2-l LLI é

Well Name:WV 16G-14-8-21 01() TAL. Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Lg L Rig Release: 4/28/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 72

Date From - To Hours Code S
e Description of Operations

4/12/2008 06:00 -22:00 16.00 LOC 3 MOVED RIG FROM SSU 16G-4-8-21 TO WV 16G-14-8-21. USED KUHR
TRUCKING AND THEY DIDA GOOD JOB.

22:00-06:00 8.00 LOC 4 RIGGED UP ENSIGN#72, SLIP AND CUT DRILL LINE, WORKED ON
ORGANIZING, SORTING AND MARKING ELECTRIC CORDS, RU BACK YARD,
RIG MOVE 100%, RU 80 % COMPLETE

4/13/2008 06:00-02:00 20.00 LOC 4 CONTINUE TO RU, INSPECT BELLYBOARD WELDS, INSTPECT RIG PRIOR TO
LIFTING DERRICK. DIG IN DITCHES AROUND SUB STRUCTURE. RAISE
DERRICK @ 12:00 PM.
UNLOAD 275 JTS. WHEATHERFORD 2 7/8" AOH DRILL PIPE, 45 JTS OF
WHEATHERFORD 27/8" HWDP, 7 1/16"- 5K BOPE STACK, POWER SWIVEL
AND 2 7/8" HANDLINGEQUIPMENT, 7 1/16" - 5K SPOOL AND ONE JT OF 27/8"
EUE FOR TESTING BOPE. RU AIR TUGGER, WIND WALLS AND ROTORY
CHAIN.

\02:00-06:00 4.00 BOP 1 CLEAN OUT TOP OF 11" X 7 1/16" CAMERON TUBING HEAD WHERE TEST
PLUG SEAT IS LOCATED, FULL OF HEAVY PARIFIN WAX, FREE UP LOCK
DOWNPINS. STACK WEATHERFORD DOUBLE PIPE AND BLIND RAMS,
ANNULAR, 2' SPOOL AND SMITH ROTATING HEAD.

4/14/2008 06:00-09:00 3.00 BOP i CONTIUNE NIPPLING UP BOPE AND TIGHTEN BOLTS.
09:00 - 12:00 3.00 LOC 4 REBUILD FLOW LINE FROM GAS BUSTER TO SHAKER POSSUM BELLY,

INSTALL FLOW LINE FROM ROTATING HEAD. PU BAILS, POWER SWIVEL,
INSTALL KELLYHOSE AND SUCTION LINE TO #1 PUMP (UNION WING BAD)

12:00 - 16:30 4.50 BOP 2 RU IPS TO PRESSURE TEST ASSOC LINES FROM PUMP DISCHARGE TO TIW
VALVE3000 PSI. KILL LINE2000 PSI, PU 27/8" ELEVATORS, 1 JT OF 27/8 EUE
AND 7 1/16" TEST PLUG, SET PLUG IN TOP OF TUBING HEAD. TEST PIPE
RAMS, ANNULAR, CHOKE MANIFOLD,CHOKE LINE, CHOKE TO 3000 PSI.
REMOVE 27/8" JT OF TBG AND TEST BLIND RAMS 3000 PSI. ALL HELD GOOD.
SCREWED BACK INTO TEST PLUG AND RETREIVED PLUG. RIG DOWN IPS
TESTERS AND 27/8" EUE TEST JT. NOTE: BLIND RAMS ON BOTTOM AND
PIPE RAMS BELOW ANNULAR.

16:30 -21:00 4.50 LOC 4 RU FLARE LINES, SET PIPE RACKS, TALLEY27/8" HWDP AND 27/8 DP, RU
ROTATING HEAD W/ 12" SPOOL AND FLOW LINE DRESSER SLEEVE.

NOTE: LOST TELEPHONE AND INTERCOM COMMUNICATIONS
21:00-22:00 1.00 CSG 1 SAFETY MEETING AND RU FRANKS PU EQUIPMENT
22:00 -00:30 2.50 TRP 1 P.U. 45 JTS HWDP AND POOH STAND BACK IN DERRICK
00:30 -02:00 1.50 TRP 2 MAKE UP 4 3/4" USED ROLLER CONE BIT, BIT SUB, AND SINGLE IN 943' OF 2

7/8" DRILL PIPE.
02:00 -06:00 4.00 SEQ 1 RU POWER SWIVEL LINES AND POWER SWIVEL TO CIRCULATE HOLE.

4/15/2008 06:00 -07:30 1.50 TRP 2 SINGLE IN THE HOLE W/ 4 3/4" BIT, BIT SUB, FLOAT SUB AND 27/8" AOH
DRILL PIPE.

07:30 -08:30 1.00 CIRC 1 FILL PIPE AND CIRCULATE EVERY 1000'. THERE IS A LOT OF ASPHALT IN THE
RETURNS.

08:30 - 12:30 4.00 TRP 2 SINGLING IN 27/8" DRILLPIPE. LOAD AND STRAP DP, TAG CIBP @4762.8T
12:30 - 13:00 0.50 CSG 1 RD FRANKS UD EQUIPMENT
13:00 - 14:30 1.50 CIRC 1 CIRCULATEHOLE CLEAN OF HEAVYASPHALT SLUGE.
14:30 - 16:30 2.00 TRP 2 TOOH W/ CLEAN OUT BIT
16:30 - 18:00 1.50 DRL 3 MAKE-UP SMITH WHIPSTOCK TOOLS
18:00 - 22:30 4.50 TRP 18 TIH W/ WHIPSTOCK RUNNING 2 MIN. PER STAND FILLING PIPE EVERY 1000'.
22:30 -01:30 3.00 LOG 4 RU CASED HOLE SOLUTIONS, PU AND RUN SCIENTIFIC GYRO SURVEY.

ORIENTATE AND SET SMITH WHIPSTOCK TO 328 DEGREES.
01:30 -04:30 3.00 DRL 3 RD WIRE LINE, RU SWIVEL POWER UNIT.. TROUBLE Wl TOUQUE GAUGE..

INSTALL ROTATING RUBBER

14/2008 8:35:35
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 4/28/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 72

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

4/15/2008 04:30 -06:00 1.50 DRL 7 MILLINGWINDOW. 1,200 FT/LBS FREE TORQUE.. ROTATIONAL TORQUE
1,220 -2,000 FT/LBS. NO WEIGHT INDICATED. TOP OF WINDOW @4,749'
DOWN 6' TO 4,755'.

4/16/2008 06:00 - 12:30 6.50 DRL 7 MILLWINDOW F/ 4,750' T/ 4,762' (12') 90 RPM, WEIGHT 0.5 K. WORKED MILLIN
AND OUT OF WINDOW, PUMPED 10 BBL, 20 BBL& 50 BBL SWEEPS. FIRST
TWO SWEEPS DIDN'T SHOW MANYCUTTINGS. CUTTING RETURNS
INCREASED WI FINALSWEEP WITH MAGNETS IN POSSUM BELL SHOWING
LOTS OF METAL MILLSLIDING THROUGH WINDOW WITH NO DRAG. T OF
OPEN HOLE INTO FORMATION. NOTE: FINALGYRO TOOL FACE = 328
DEGREES.

12:30 - 13:00 0.50 TRP 2 RIG DOWN POWER SWIVEL.
13:00 -15:00 2.00 TRP 2 SAFETY MEETING W/ CREWS, VERY HIGH WINDS. TOH W/ MILLASSEMBLY.
15:00 -18:00 3.00 TRP 3 LAYDOWN 48 JTS OF 27/8" AOH TUBING TO MAKE ROOM FOR OPEN HOLE.
18:00 -18:30 0.50 TRP 2 LAYDOWN MILLBHA, LOOKED GOOD W/ BOTTOM MILLIN GAUGE, MIDDLE

MILL1/8" UNDER AND TOP MILL1/8" UNDER. VERY LITTLE CUTTER MATERIAL
MISSING.

18:30 -22:00 3.50 TRP 2 PU SCIENTIFIC DIRECTIONAL BHA, 4 3/4" XR 20 BIT, MOTOR 1.75 DEGREE / 1
REV/GAL.

22:00 -02:30 4.50 TRP 2 TlH W/ DIRECTIONAL BHA TO 4,733'
02:30 -03:00 0.50 SEQ 1 R/U POWER SWIVEL
03:00-04:30 1.50 SUR 1 R/U GYRO WIRE LINE IN DERRICK
04:30 -05:00 0.50 SUR 1 RiH WITH GYRO SURVEY TOOL & SEAT
05:00 -06:00 1.00 DRL 3 ORIENTATE TOOL FACE

4/17/2008 06:00 - 12:30 6.50 DRL 2 DIRECTIONAL DRILL(SLIDE) F/ 4,76T Tl 4.796' (29') AROP 4.5 FPH, WOB 11.2K,
DIFF 119 PSI, PP 770, 79 GPM

12:30-13:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE AND LUBRICATE RIG
13:00 -14:30 1.50 LOG 4 PULL GYRO TOOL TO MAKE DOUBLE CONNECTIONS
14:30 - 16:00 1.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/4,796', T/4,812' (16') AROP 10.6 FPH, WOB 38.6, 756 PSI, DIFF 106 PSI
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 LOG 4 RECALIBRATE GYRO
16:30 - 18:30 2.00 DRL 2 SLIDE Fl 4,812' TO 4,830' (18') AROP 9 FPH, WOB 20.9, 100 GPM, 741 PSI, DIFF

118 PSI
18:30 - 19:00 0.50 LOG 4 RECALIBRATE GYRO
19:00 -21:00 2.00 DRL 2 SLIDE F/4,830' T/4,85T (2T) AROP 13.5 FPH, WOB 39K, 126 GPM, 1325 PSI, DIFF

160 PSI
21:00 -22:00 1.00 LOG 4 MWD SURVEY TMD @4,822' INC 10, AZM 10.34, TVD 4,819', RD SCIENTIFIC

DRILLING GYRO AND CASEDHOLE SOLUTIONS, MAKE CONNECTION.
22:00 -01:30 3.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/4,822' TO 4,891' (69') AROP 19.7 FPH, WOB 39K, 130 GPM, 1247 PSI,

DIFF 120 PSI.
01:30 - 02:00 0.50 SUR 1 CONNNECTION & SURVEY TMD 4,891' INC 16.79, AZM 9.02, TVD 4849'
02:00 -03:30 1.50 DRL 1 ROTATE. DRILLF/4,891, T/4,906' (15') AROP 10' FPH, WOB 25K, 130 GPM, 1225

PSI, DIFF 140 PSI
03:30 -06:00 2.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/4,906' TI 4,923 (17') AROP FPH, WOB 39K, 130 GPM, 1247 PSI, DIFF

120 PSI.
4/18/2008 06:00 -08:00 2.00 DRL 2 ROTATE F/4,923' Tl4,939' (16') AROP 8 FPH, WOB 18K, DIFF PRESS 112 PSI, PP

1198, SPM75, 130 GPM,MOTOR110 RPM
08:00 -08:30 0.50 SUR 1 MAKE CONNECTION AND SURVEY@ 4,916', INC 24.15, AZM 8.57, TVD 4,908'
08:30 - 11:00 2.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/4,939' T/4,986' (4T) AROP 23.5 FPH, WOB 25K, DIFF PRESS 138 PSI, PP

799, 60 SPM, 104 GPM, MOTOR 88 RPM
11:00 - 11:15 0.25 SUR 1 SURVEY @4,949', INC 25.62, AZM 4.07 TVD @4,938'
11:15 -14:15 3.00 DRL 2 SLIDE F/4,986' Tl5,016' (30') AROP 10 FPH, WOB 25K, DIFF PRESS 72 PSI, PP

847 PSI, SPM 61, 105 GPM, MOTOR 89 RPM
14:15-14:45 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE AND LUBRICATE RIG
14:45 - 18:45 4.00 DRL 2 SLIDE F/5,016' T/5,048' (32') AROP 8 FPH, WOB 26K, DIFF PRESS 118 PSI, PP

Printed: 9/4/2008 8:35:35
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 4/28/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 72

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

4/18/2008 14:45 - 18:45 4.00 DRL 2 844 PSI, 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 90 RPM
18:45 -19:00 0.25 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,012, INC 29.81, AZM 348.14 TVD @4,994'
19:00 - 22:00 3.00 DRL 2 PUMP 20 BBL HIGH VIS GEULIME SWEEP, SLIDE F/5,048' T/ 5,080' (32') AROP

10.6 FPH, WOB 28K, DIFF PRESS 110 PSI, PP 855 PSI, 85 SPM, 105 GPM,
MOTOR 90 RPM

22:00 -22:30 0.50 SUR 1 MAKECONNECTION AND SURVEY @5,042', INC 32.69, AZM 339.62 TVD @
5,019'

22:30 -02:00 3.50 DRL 2 PUMP 20 BBL HIGH VIS GEULIME SWEEP, SLIDE F/5,080' T/5,111' (31') AROP
8.8 FPH, WOB 28K, DIFF PRESS 110 PSI, PP 855 PSI, 85 SPM, 105 GPM,
MOTOR 90 RPM

02:00 -02:30 0.50 SUR 1 MAKECONNECTION AND SURVEY @5,073' lNC 36.08, AZM 334.95 TVD @
5,045'

02:30 -04:30 2.00 DRL 2 PUMP 20 BBL HIGH VIS GEULIME SWEEP, SLIDE F/5,111' T/ 5,12T (16') AROP 8
FPH, WOB 28K, DIFF PRESS 110 PSi, PP 855 PSI, 85 SPM, 105 GPM, MOTOR 90
RPM

04:30-05:00 0.50 TRP 12 STAND BACK SWIVEL AND TOH W/ DIRECTIONAL EQUIPMENT FROM A
TOTAL MEASURED DEPTH OF 5,12T. TOTAL

4/19/2008 06:00 -08:30 2.50 TRP 12 SAFETY MEETING W/ CREW, FUNCTION TEST C.O.M.TOOH W/4 3/4" TRI
CONE AND 1.75 BENT MOTOR ASSEMBLY

08:30 -11:30 3.00 TRP 1 CHANGE OUT 4 3/4" BIT W/ SMITH 609 WPX AND 2.12 DEGREE BICO MOTOR
W/ 1.5 REV/GAL. L/D UBHO SUB FOR GYRO. ADD 3 STANDS FOR A TOTAL OF
8 STANDS OF PUSH PlPE. ORIIENT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS.

11:30 -15:00 3.50 TRP 2 TIH FILLING PIPE EVERY 10 STANDS. MIXHIGH VIS SWEEP TO CIRCULATE
AND FAN BOTTOM TO REMOVE ANY BIT INSERTS LEFT FROM TRI-CONE BIT.

15:00 -16:00 1.00 SEQ 1 R.U. WEATHERFORD 3 1/2" POWER SWIVEL, NOTE: CHANGED OUT POWER
UNIT WHILECHANGING BHA.

16:00 -17:00 1.00 CIRC 1 FILLDRILL PIPE, TAG 4' OF FILLAND WASH TO BOTTOM @5,12T. FAN DOWN
WHILE CIRCULATING SWEEP AROUND AT 150 GPM. CIRCULATE BOTTOMS
UP.

17:00 -00:30 7.50 DRL 2 SLIDE Fl5,12T T/ 5,175' (48') AROP 6.4 FPM, WOB 2/8K, DIFF PRESS 68 PSI, 64
SPM, 110 GPM, 850 PSI, MOTOR 165 RPM NOTE: RESET MWD TOOL DUE TO
CAMP GENERATOR GOING DOWN.

00:30 -01:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,134' INC 41.64, AZM325.57 TVD5,093'.
01:00 -02:30 1.50 DRL 3 SLIDE F/5,175' T/ 5,190' {15') AROP 10 FPH, WOB 4/9K, DIFF PRESS 148 PSI, 64

SPM, BUILD RATE ONLY 11.7 DEGREES PER 100', NEED 17 DEGREES. PULL
MOTOR TO INCREASE ANGLE FROM 2.12 TO 2.7

02:30 -03:00 0.50 SEQ 1 STAND BACK POWER SWlVEL
03:00-06:00 3.00 TRP 2 TOOH TO INCREASE MOTOR ANGLE, PULLED GOOD PAST WHIPSTOCK,

HOLE CONDITION GOOD.
4/20/2008 06:00 -06:30 0.50 TRP 2 SAFETY MEETING W/ CREW & REVIEW JSA, TOH FOR MOTOR ANGLE

CHANGE
06:30-07:00 0.50 SEQ 1 SAND BACK POWER SWlVEL
07:00 -08:00 1.00 DRL 3 SET MOTOR BEND TO 2.77* INSTALL4 3/4" HUGHES STX-20 W/ 3-16'S TFA

.589

08:00 -09:30 1.50 TRP 12 TIH W/ DIRECTIONAL BHA, FILLINGDP EVERY 10 STANDS
09:30 -10:30 1.00 RIG 2 REPAIR SPINNER CHAIN (CODE 8)
10:30 -12:30 2.00 TRP 12 FINISH TIH. ORIENT MOTOR ANGLE AT WINDOW IN ORDER TO ENTER

KlCK-OFF, 10 -20K OF DRAG DOWN TO 45' ABOVE TD @ 5,190'.
12:30-13:00 0.50 SEQ i RU POWER SWIVEL
13:00 -15:00 2.00 REAM 1 WASH AND REAM45' TO BTM @5,190'.
15:00 -16:30 1.50 DRL 2 ORIENT AZM TO 330* SLIDE FI 5,190' T/ 5.211' (21') WOB 14/26K, DIFF PRESS

137 PSI, PP 911, PUMP #2 86 SPM, 107 GPM, MOTOR 167 RPM.
16:30 -17:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,166', INC 44.81, AZM328.17

Printed: 9/4/2008 6:35:35
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 4/28/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 72

Date From - To Hours Code S
e Description of Operations

4/20/2008 17:00 - 17:30 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE & LUBRICATERIG
17:30 -18:00 0.50 RIG 2 RIG POWER PLANT WENT DOWN, START POWER PLANT AND RE-BOOT

ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT
18:00 - 22:30 4.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/ 5,211' T/ 5,238' (2T) WOB 14/26K, DIFF PRESS 137 PSI, PP 911, PUMP

#2 86 SPM, 107 GPM, MOTOR 167 RPM.
22:30 -00:00 1.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,197', INC 50.55, AZM 329.70 AND RELOG GAMMA F/5,207, TO

5,238' DUE TO POWER OUTAGE FROM GENERATOR
00:00 - 03:30 3.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/ 5,238' T/ 5,270' (32') WOB 14/20K, DIFF PRESS 137 PSI, PP 911, PUMP

#2 86 SPM, 107 GPM, MOTOR 167 RPM.
03:30 -04:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,229', INC 57.94, AZM327.8; PROJECTED TO BIT @5,270' INC

67.41, AZM329.95
04:00 - 05:00 1.00 DRL 2 SLIDE F/ 5.270' T/ 5,280' (10') WOB 14/20K, DIFF PRESS 186 PSI, PP 911, PUMP

#2 86 SPM, 103 GPM, MOTOR 160 RPM.
05:00 -05:30 0.50 TRP 12 STAND BACK POWER SWIVEL
05:30 -06:00 0.50 TRP 12 MARK KELLYJT, TOH ON EVEN STANDS.

4/21/2008 06:00 - 08:30 2.50 TRP 12 TOOH W/ DIRECTIONAL BHA,
08:30 -09:30 1.00 TRP 1 UD HUGHES 4 3/4" STX-20, CHANGE MOTOR ANGLE FROM 2.77* TO 1.50*, P/U

NEW 4 3/4" HUGHES 4 3/4" STX-20 W/ 3-16'S, TFA .589. CHECKED MOTOR
OUT PUT SHAFT BEARING END PLAY, LOOKED GOOD.

09:30 - 11:00 1.50 TRP 2 TIH W/ DIRECTIONAL BHA & 8 STANDS PUSH PIPE,
11:00 - 11:30 0.50 TRP 2 CHANGE OUT SHORT WEATHERFORD 27/8 AOH DP PIN X 27/8" H-90 HWDP

BOX CROSS OVER WITH 36" LONG X-O. BOTH SHORT DRILL PIPE X-O'S HAVE
BEEN REPLACED WITH API LENGTH.

11:30 - 14:00 2.50 TRP 2 TlH FILLINGPIPE EVERY 10 STANDS.
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 SEQ 1 RU POWER SWIVEL
14:30 - 16:30 2.00 DRL 3 SLIDE Fl5,280' T/5,304' (24') WOB 14/20K, DIFF PRESS 126 PSI, PP 864, PUMP

#2 86 SPM, 101 GPM, MOTOR 157 RPM.
16:30 - 17:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5263', INC 65.75, AZM331.86, TVD 5,171, MAKE CONNECTION
17:00 - 20:00 3.00 DRL 2 SLIDE F/5,304' T/5,33T (33') AROP 11 FPH, WOB 14/20K, DIFF PRESS 126 PSI,

i PP 864, PUMP #2 86 SPM, 101 GPM, MOTOR 157 RPM. PUMP HIGH VIS SWEEP
20:00 - 20:30 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5295', INC 69.71, AZM 332.98, TVD 5,184, MAKE CONNECTION
20:30 - 23:00 2.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/5,33T T/5,352' (15') AROP 6 FPH, WOB 14/20K, DIFF PRESS 173 PSI,

PP 864, PUMP #2 86 SPM, 101 GPM, MOTOR 157 RPM. PUMPHIGH VIS SWEEP.
NOTE: ANGLE NOT BUILDINGAS ANTISIPATED; ONLY BUILDING4.07* NEED
9.95*. PREPARE TO TOOH TO INCREASE MOTOR ANGLE TO 2.38*.

23:00 - 23:30 0.50 SEQ 1 RD POWER SWlVEL
23:30 -02:30 3.00 TRP 12 TOOH TO VISUALLYINSPECT BHA ANDCHANGE MOTOR ANGLE, LOOKING

FOR ANY REASON OUR ANGLE IS NOT BUILDINGAS PREDICTED. INCREASE
BIT TFA TO .746 HELPING TO REDUCE WASH OUT.

02:30 -03:30 1.00 DRL 3 SET MOTOR BEND TO 2.38* AND REMOVE JET FROM BIT
03:30 -04:30 1.00 TRP .2 TIH Wl DIRECTIONAL BHA & 8 STANDS PUSH PIPE,
04:30 -06:00 1.50 TRP 2 TlH FILLING PIPE EVERY 10 STANDS.

4/22/2008 06:00 -06:30 0.50i SEQ 1 RU POWER SWIVEL
06:30 -07:30 1.00 REAM 1 WASH 5,20T TO TD @5,352' (145')
07:30 - 09:30 2.00 DRL 2 SLIDE F/5,352' T/5,365' (13') AROP 6.5 FPH, WOB 35K, DIFF PRESS 98 PSI, PP

811, PUMP #1 64 SPM, 98 GPM,MOTOR 152 RPM.
09:30 - 10:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,326' INC 71.25, AZM333.35, TVD 5,194.38, MAKE CONNECTION
10:00 - 16:00 6.00 DRL 2 SLIDE F/ 5,365' T/5,39T (38') AROP 6.4 FPH, WOB 28K, DIFF PRESS 89 PSI, PP

834, PUMP #1 62 SPM, 107 GPM, MOTOR 166 RPM. PUMP 10 BBL HIGH VIS
SWEEP.

16:00 -16:30 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,358' INC 74.48, AZM 333.21, TVD 5.203
16:30 - 19:30 3.00 DRL 2 SLIDE Fl 5,39T T/5,412' (15') AROP 4.2 FPH, WOB 28K, DIFF PRESS 129 PSI, PP

874 PUMP #1 64 SPM, 110 GPM,MOTOR 171 RPM.

Printed: 9/4/2006 8 35:35
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name: WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 4/28/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 72

Date From - To Hours Code Description of Operations

4/22/2008 19:30 -20:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,373' INC 77.30, AZM333.43, TVD 5,207, PROJECTED TO BIT @
5,414' INC 85.01, AZM 343.03, TVD 5213.76.

20:00 - 20:30 0.50 SEQ 1 RD POWER SWIVEL
20:30 -23:30 3.00 TRP 2 TOOH TO CHANGE MOTOR AND BIT.
23:30 - 02:00 2.50 TRP 1 L/D HUGHES 4 3/4" STX-20, CHANGE OUT MOTOR ANGLE TO 1.50*, P/U NEW 4

3/4" SMITH M609WPX Wl1-13 & 2-18'S, CHECKED MOTOR OUT PUT SHAFT
BEARING END PLAY, LOOKED GOOD.

02:00 -03:30 1.50 TRP 2 TlH W/ DIRECTIONAL BHA & 20 STANDS PUSH PIPE,
03:30 -05:30 2.00 TRP 2 TIH FILLINGPIPE EVERY 15 STANDS, TO 5,242'
05:30 - 06:00 0.50 SEQ 1 R/U POWER SWIVEL

4/23/2008 06:00 - 07:30 1.50 REAM i WASH AND REAM Fl 5,242' T/5,414' (172')
07:30 -08:30 1.00 DRL 2 ROTATE4 3/4" PDC W/ 1.5* BENT MOTOR F/5,414' T/ 5,432' (18') AROP 18' FPH,

WOB 6.3K, DIFF PRESS 196.2 PSI, PP 732 PSI, #1 61 SPM, 105 GPM, MOTOR
163 RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT 193 RPM.

08:30 -09:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,390', INC 80.28, AZM332.22, TVD 5,210.79 AND CONNECTION
09:00 - 11:00 2.00 DRL 2 ROTATE 4 3/4" PDC W/ 1.5* BENT MOTOR F/5,432' T/ 5,47T (45') AROP 22.5

FPH, WOB 6.3K, DIFF PRESS 196.2 PSI, PP 732 PS1, #1 61 SPM, 105 GPM,
MOTOR 163 RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT193 RPM.

11:00 - 11:30 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,421', INC 84.34, AZM 332.28, TVD 5,214.93' AND CONNECTION
11:30 -13:00 1.50 DRL 2 SLIDE 4 3/4" PDC W/ 1.5* BENT MOTOR Fl5,477 T/ 5.494' (11') AROP 7.5' FPH,

WOB 8.4K, DIFF PRESS 90 PSI, PP 812 PSI, #1 61 SPM, 105 GPM, MOTOR 163
RPM

13:00 - 13:30 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,452', INC 84.35, AZM 331.28, TVD 5,217.99' AND CONNECTION
13:30-14:00 0.50 RIG 1 SERVICE AND LUBRICATE RIG
14:00 - 14:30 0.50 DRL 2 ROTATE 4 3/4" PDC W/ 1.5* BENT MOTOR F/5,494' T/ 5,525' (31') AROP 62 FPH,

WOB 4.1K, DIFF PRESS 190 PSI, PP 966 PSI, #1 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 165
RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT 195 RPM.

14:30 - 15:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,485', INC 85.20, AZM330.66, TVD 5,220.99' ANDCONNECTION
15:00 -15:30 0.50 DRL 2 ROTATE 4 3/4" PDC W/ 1.5* BENT MOTOR F/5,525' T/ 5,55T (32') AROP 64 FPH,

WOB 3.5K, DIFF PRESS 192 PSI, PP 966 PSI, #1 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 165
RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM. BIT 195 RPM.

15:30 - 16:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,515', INC 85.50, AZM330.65, TVD 5,223.43' AND CONNECTION
16:00 - 16:30 0.50 DRL 2 ROTATE 4 3/4" PDC W/ 1.5* BENT MOTOR F/5,557 T/ 5,562' (5') AROP 10 FPH,

WOB 3.5K, DIFF PRESS 192 PSI, PP 966 PSI, #1 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 165
RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT 195 RPM.

16:30 - 18:30 2.00 DRL 2 SLIDE 4 3/4" PDC W/ 1.5* BENT MOTOR F/5,562' T/ 5,582' (20') AROP 10 FPH,
WOB 14.5K, DIFF PRESS 109 PSI, PP 952 PSI, #1 61 SPM, 105 GPM, MOTOR
163

18:30 - 19:00 0.50 DRL 2 ROTATE F/5,582T/5,588' (6') AROP 12 FPH WOB 3.5K, DIFF PRESS 192 PSI, PP
966 PSI, #1 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 165 RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT 195
RPM.

19:00 - 19:30 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,54T, INC 85.66, AZM330.39, TVD 5,225.90' AND CONNECTION
19:30 - 20:30 1.00 DRL 2 ROTATEF/5,588T/5,619' (31') AROP 31 FPH WOB 3.5K, DIFF PRESS 192 PSI, PP

966 PSI, #1 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 165 RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT 195
RPM.

20:30 -21:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,578', INC 88.32, AZM330.40, TVD 5.22152' AND CONNECTION
21:00 -21:30 0.50 DRL 2 ROTATE F/5,619T/5,650' (31'} AROP 62 FPH WOB 3.5K, DIFF PRESS 192 PSI, PP

966 PSI, #1 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 165 RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT 195
RPM.

21:30 - 22:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,609', INC 88.92, AZM330.54, TVD 5,228.83' AND CONNECTION
22:00 -22:30 0.50 DRL 2 ROTATE F/5,650T/5,66T (1T) AROP 34 FPH WOB 3.5K, DIFF PRESS 165 PSI, PP

966 PSI, #1 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 165 RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT 195
i RPM.
I
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 4/28/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 72

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

4/23/2008 22:30 -01:30 3.00 DRL 2 SLIDE 4 3/4" PDC W/ 1.5* BENT MOTOR F/5,66T T/ 5,67T (10') AROP 2.8' FPH,
WOB 8.8K, DIFF PRESS 150 PSI, PP 812 PSI, #1 61 SPM, 105 GPM, MOTOR 163
RPM

01:30 -02:30 1.00 DRL 2 ROTATE F/5,677T/5,697 (20') AROP 20 FPH WOB 3.5K, DIFF PRESS 180 PSI, PP
975 PSI, #1 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 165 RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT 195
RPM.

02:30 -04:00 1.50 DRL 2 SLIDE 4 3/4" PDC W/ 1.5* BENT MOTOR F/5,697T/5,701' (4') AROP 2.6' FPH,
WOB 9.5K, DIFF PRESS 195 PSI, PP 812 PSI, #1 61 SPM, 105 GPM, MOTOR 163
RPM

04:00 -04:30 0.50 DRL 2 ROTATE F/5,701T/5,713' (12') AROP 24 FPH WOB 3.5K, DIFF PRESS 170 PSI, PP
937 PSI, #1 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 165 RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT 195
RPM.

04:30 - 05:00 0.50 SUR 1 SURVEY @5,672', INC 88.22, AZM330.20, TVD 5,229.16' AND CONNECTION
05:00 -06:00 1.00 DRL 2 ROTATE F/5,713T/5,744' (31') AROP 31 FPH WOB 8K, DIFF PRESS 170 PSI, PP

928 PSI, #1 62 SPM, 106 GPM, MOTOR 165 RPM, ROTORY 30 RPM, BIT 195
RPM.

4/24/2008 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 ROTATE F/5744 T/5868 ' (124FT 7 HR) AROP 17.7 FPH WOB 5/7, DIFF PRESS
210 PSI, SPP 910 PSI, PUMP #1 62 SPM, 112 GPM, MOTOR RPM 175, ROTARY
RPM 30, DH RPM 205, SURVEY ON ALLCONNECTIONS, BOP DRILL

13:00 -13:30 0.50 RIG i RIG SERVICE
13:30 -16:30 3.00 DRL 1 ROTATE/SLIDE F/5868 T/5917(ROTATE 45 FT 2.5 HR) (SLIDE 4 FT O.5HR)

AROP 16.3 FPH WOB 5/21, DIFF PRESS 210 PSI, SPP 910 PSI. PUMP #1 62
SPM, 112 GPM, MOTOR RPM 175, ROTARY RPM 30, DH RPM 205, SURVEY ON
ALLCONNECTIONS

16:30 -21:30 5.00 DRL 2 SLIDE F/5917 T/5923 (6 FT THR) ROTATE F/5923 T/5963 (40 FT 2 HR) SLIDE
F/5963 T/5975 (12 FT 2HR) AROP 19.3, WOB 5/21, DIFF PRESS 85/200, MOTOR
RPM 175, ROTARY RPM 30, DH RPM 205 SLOWED DOWN ROP ON ROTATION
TO 6 FT/HR GEOLOGICAL SAMPLES SHOWS WE ARE IN CENTER OF PAY
FORMATION, GAMMAAT BIT DEPTH OF 5975 STARTED IN THE 70'S, AT BIT
DEPTH OF 6025 WENT DOWN TO MID40'S

21:30 -03:30 6.00 DRL 1 ROTATE F/5975 T/6026 (51 FT 6 HR) AROP 8.5, WOB 6, DIFF PRESS 118/134,
MMRPM 175, ROTARY RPM 30, DH RPM 205, GAMMA46 SURVEY @5985 INC
86.40 AZ 329.69 TVD 5249.03

03:30 - 05:00 1.50 CIRC 1 PUMP 40BBL HIGH VISC SWEEP IN PREPERATION OF SHORT TRIP TO 5242
05:00 -06:00 1.00 TRP 14 RIG DOWN SWlVEL, SHORT TRIP F/6026 T/5242

4/25/2008 06:00 -06:30 0.50 TRP 14 TIH TAG BOTTOM WITH 4 FT OF FILL TRIP BOP DRILL
06:30 -07:30 1.00 CIRC 1 PICK UP POWER SWIVEL CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN TO 6026
07:30 - 12:00 4.50 DRL 2 SLIDE F/6026 T/6031 (5FT 1.5HRS) ROTATE Fl6031 T/6057 (26FT 3HRS)

AROP 6.8 FPH, WOB 8/36, SPP 950, DIFF PRESS 108, PUMP #1 62 SPM, MM
RPM 175, ROTARY RPM 30, DH RPM 205

12:00 - 12:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
12:30 -00:30 12.00 DRL 1 ROTATE F/6057 Tl 6198 (141 FT) AROP 11,75 FPH WOB 8, DIFF PRESS 224

PSI, SPP 1022 PSI, PUMP #1 62 SPM, 112 GPM, MM RPM 175, ROTARY RPM 30,
DH RPM 205, SURVEY ON ALLCONNECTIONS

00:30 -01:30 1.00 DRL 2 SLIDEF/6198 T/6200 (2FT) WOB 32
01:30 -06:00 4.50 DRL 1 ROTATE F/6200 T/ 6277 (77 FT) AROP 15.4 FPH, WOB 7.5 DIFF PRESS 225, SPP

1018, PUMP #1 62 STK, GPM 112, MM RPM 175, ROTARY RPM 30, DH RPM 205
SURVEY ALLCONNECTIONS

4/26/2008 06:00 - 13:00 7.00 DRL 1 ROTATE F/62T7 T/66340 (63 FT) SLIDE F/6340 T/ 6343 (3 FT 0.5HR) ROTATE
F/6343 T/6434 (91 FT) AROP 22.4 FPH, WOB 10, PUMP #1 62 STK, GPM 112,
DIFF PRESS 300, MM RPM 175, ROTARY RPM 30. DH RPM 205

13:00-13:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIGSERVICE
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 4/28/2008
Rig Name: ENSIGN Rig Number: 72

SubDate From - To Hours Code Code Description of Operations

4/26/2008 13:30 -17:00 3.50 DRL 1 ROTATE F/6434 Tl6529 (95 FT) AROP 27 FPH, WOB 10, PUMP #1 62 STK, GPM
112, SPP 1150 DIFF PRESS 290, MM RPM 175, ROTARY RPM 30, DH RPM 205

17:00 -19:00 2.00 TRP 14 STAND BACK POWER SWlVEL, SHORT TRIP TO 6036 6STANDS, PICK UP
POWER SWIVEL

19:00 -19:30 0.50 TRP 2 KELLYJOINT BROKE OUT FROM SWIVEL THREADS ON JOINT GALLED,
LAYEDIT DOWN FOR FUTURE INSPECTION, PICK UP NEW KELLYJOINT

19:30 -06:00 10.50 DRL 1 ROTATE F/6529 T/6865 (336 FT) AROP 32, WOB 5, PUMP #1 62 STKS, GPM 112,
DIFF PRESS 320, SPP 1140, MM RPM 175, ROTARY RPM 30, DH RPM 205

4/27/2008 06:00 - 11:00 5.00 DRL 1 ROTATE F/ 6865 T/7000 (135 FT) TD AROP 27 FPH, WOB 9, SPP 1150, DIFF
PRESS 330, PUMP #1 62 STKS, GPM 112, MM RPM 175, ROTARY RPM 30, DH
RPM 205, SURVEY @6959INC 89.13 AZ 329.31 TVD 5284.43 PROJECTION TO
BIT 7000 INC 89.96 AZ 330.38 TVD 5285.83 -- -- TD CUTTINGS SAMPLE 50/50
LIME/SHALE.3RD PARTY GAS BASE LINE INCREASE TO 700UNITS FROM
300UNITS IN LAST 50' OF HOLE

11:00-12:00 1.00 CIRC 1 CIRCULATE BTMS UP AND CONDITION HOLE, STAND BACK SWIVEL
12:00 -15:00 3.00 TRP 14 TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO 4764, TIH TO 7000, PICK UP POWER SWIVEL
15:00 -17:00 2.00 CIRC 1 PUMP 40 BBL HIGH VISC SWEEP, CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE W/2X

HOLE VOLUME
17:00 -17:30 0.50 RIG 1 RIG SERVICE
17:30 - 18:00 0.50 RIG 2 RIG REPAIR, BROKEN PIPE SPINNER CHAIN ON HAWK JAW
18:00 -22:30 4.50 TRP 2 POOH TO RUN 3.5 PERFORATED LINER
22:30-00:00 1.50 TRP 1 LAYDOWN BHA, MWD, NMDC, MM, BIT
00:00-02:30 2.50 CSG 1 SAFETY MEETING, RIG UP CASING AND LAYDOWN CREWS
02:30-06:00 3.50 CSG 4 RUN 3.5 PERFORATED LINER, OPEN GUIDE SHOE

4/28/2008 06:00 -08:00 2.00 CSG 4 RUN 3.5 PERFORATED LINER
08:00-11:30 3.50 CSG 1 RIG DOWN WEATHERFORD CASING CREW (1HR) RIG DOWN

WEARTHERFORD T.R.S. (2.5 HR)
11:30 - 14:30 3.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE WITH 27/8 AOH AND 3.5 PERFORATED LINER
14:30 -15:00 0.50 CSG 4 HANG LINER @4638
15:00-20:00 5.00 TRP 3 LAYDOWN 27/8 DRILLPIPE. LAYDOWN FLAG POLE
20:00 -22:00 2.00 TRP 2 TRIP IN HOLE WITH HWDP AND DP OUT OF DERRICK, PICK UP FLAG POLE
22:00 -01:00 3.00 TRP 3 LAYDOWN DRILL PIPE AND HWDP
01:00 -02:00 1.00 TRP 3 RIG DOWN LAYDOWN CREW
02:00-04:30 2.50 DEQ 1 RIG UP WIRELINE TO SET WIRELINE RETRIEVABLE BRIDGE PLUG, RUN

GUAGE RING AND JUNK BASKETT, RUN IN WITH WEATHERFORD BRIDGE
PLUG, SET COLLET STYLE BRIDGE PLUG @4130, RIG DOWN WIRELINE

04:30-05:00 0.50 LOC 8 CLEAN MUD PITS, RIG RELEASE @05:00
05:00 -06:00 1.00 LOC 8 CLEAN RIG FOR RIG DOWN.
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Operations Summary Report ÛOmp CRM

Well Name: WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002Ho enom TALLocation: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 7/31/2003
Rig Name: SEI gg L-- Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code CSu Description of Operations

5/16/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 BOP 1 TIGHT HOLE - Completion of new horizontal Lateral.

On 5/15/08 MIRU Rocky Mtn WS. NDWH & NU BOP's. SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: Will tally& rabbit in the hole with tbg & ret head.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5# J-55

5/20/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 5 TIGHT HOLE - Completion of new horizontal Lateral.
Horizontal Lateral is in the G-1 Lime.

On 5/16/08 SICP = 0#. Tally & rabbit in the hole with ret head and used 2-7/8" EUE
8rd 6.5# J-55 tbg to 4020'. RBP is set @4130'. Circ hole w/ 2% KCLwater and circ
out 10 bbis of heavy black oil. SIFW.

On 5/19/08 Circ hole with 50 bbis of hot 2% KCLwater. Continue in the hole from
4020'to RBP @4130'. Latch onto plug and release plug and POOH with plug and tbg
and lay down plug. NU additonal pipe ram with 2-3/8" rams and SIFN.

24 Hour Forecast: On 5/20/08 willtallyand rabbit in the hole with 2-3/8" hydrilltbg and
2-7/8" EUE tbg and attemptto get into the liner.

Csg Size: 5-1/2" 15.5# J-55

5/22/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 2 TIGHT HOLE- Completion of new horizontal Lateral.
Horizontallateral is in the G-1 Lime.

On 5/20/08 SICP = 20#. Bled off well. PU & tallyin the hole with 80 jts of 2-3/8" 4.7#
hydrilltbg; x-over & 148 jts of 2-7/8" tbg to 6990'. Had no tag RIH. SlFN. Well will
remainSI on 5/21/08 waiting on acid crew.

24 Hour Forecast: Will acidize.

Csg Size: 3-1/2" 9.2# from 4638' to 7000'
5-1/2" 15.5# J-55

Perfs:
OH lateral from 4750' to 7000'
withslotted liner from 4638' to 7000'
Window @4750'

5/23/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 1 TlGHT HOLE - Completion of new horizontal Lateral.
Horizontal lateral is in the G-1 Lime.

On 5/22/08 SITP and SICP=550#. Bled off gas. Pull tbg tailto 6866'. MIRU
Hallburton and acidized the G-1 LimeIn three separate stages using 3000 gals of 15%
HCL acidwith additivesper stage at 3.3 PBM down the tbg.asper procedure with the
tbg.settingsas follows: 6866', 655T an 5935'. Pressures on all stages were between
1400-1500# at 3.3 BPM when the acid was bullhead. Flushed allacid to end of
tbg.beforepullingtbgtothe nextstage. RDMOHalliburton. POOH with2-7/8"tbgand
lay down the 2-3/8" hydril tbg. RIH with barred NC; 1 jt of tbg.; SN; 5-1/2" B-2 anchor
and tbg to 1530'. SIFN. Alltbg.is 2-7/8" EUE 8rd 6.5# J-55. On 5/23/08 willcontinue
to RIH with production string. Total of 9000 gals of 15% HCL acid was used today.
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 7/31/2003
Rig Name: SEI Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

5/23/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 1 24 Hour Forecast: Will acidize.

Csg Size: 3-1/2" 9.2# from 4638' to 7000'
5-1/2" 15.5# J-55

LLTR: 420 bbis

Perfs:
OH lateral from 4750' to 7000'
withslotted liner from 4638' to 7000'
Window @4750'

5/27/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 STIM 1 TIGHT HOLE - Completion of new horizontal Lateral.
Horizontal lateral is in the G-1 Lime.

On 5/23/08 SICP & SITP = 450#. Bled off well and pump 15 bbis of 10# brine down
the tbg. Final RIH w/ production stringw/ 2-7/8" tbg. Set tbg tail@460T & B-2
anchor @4575' w/ 12M# tension. ND BOP's & NU WH. RU swab. IFL @200'.
Make 4 swab runs and recovered 32 bbis of water with a final oil cut of 2% and a final
SICP = 180#. FFL = 700'. Final PH = 6. RD swab and SI for holiday weekend.

Csg Size: 3-1/2" 9.2# from 4638' to 7000'
5-1/2" 15.5# J-55

LLTR: 403 bbis

Perfs:
OH Iateral from 4750' to 7000'
with slotted liner from 4638' to 7000'
Window @4750'

5/28/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 TIGHT HOLE - Completion of new horizontal Lateral.
Horizontal lateral is in the G-1 Lime.

On AM of 5/27/08 SITP & SICP = 520#. Bled down tbg& flowed back 2 bbis of oil and
26 bbis of water & died. RU swab. IFL @ surface. Make 20 swab runs and recovered
an additional 136 bbis of fluid with a 2% oil cut and gas cut with FFL with a final PH = 7
& a final SICP = 70#with a swab entryrate of 27 BPH. RD swab and SIFN.
Recovered a totalof 164 bbls of fluid today.

24 Hour Forecast: Will run rods & pump & return well to production.

LLTR: 248 bbis

Csg Size: 3-1/2" 9.2# from 4638' to7000'
5-1/2" 15.5# J-55

Perfs:
OH lateral from 4750' to 7000'
with slotted liner from 4638' to 7000'
Window @4750'

Tbg Detail: Barred NC; 1 jt; SN; 5-1/2" B-2 anchor; 147 jts tosurface. Tbg Tail @

l
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 7/31/2003
Rig Name: SEI Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code C Description of Operations

5/28/2008 06:00 -16:00 10.00 SWAB 1 4607.6T; SN @4576.08'; B-2 Anchor @4575' wl a KB detail of 14'. AIIdepths
corrected to KB depths.

Barred NC = 0.44'; 1 jt of tbg = 31.15'; SN = 1.10'; B-2 Anchor = 2.78'; 147 jts of tbg =

4557.20'; Stretch = 1.0'; KB = 14.0'. Tbg tail@4607.6T; SN @4576.08'; Anchor B-2
w/ 12M# tensionat 4574.98'. Alltbg is 2-7/8" EUE 8rd J-55 6.5#.

5/29/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 TRP 18 TIGHT HOLE - Completion of new horizontal Lateral.
Horizontal lateral is in the G-1 Lime.

On 5/28/08 SITP & SICP = 550#. Flush tbg with 50 bbis of hot 2% KCL water. Bucket
test new pump - OK. RIH wl pump, 100 - new 3/4" grade "D" rods, 82 -7/8" new
grade "D" rods, 1-4'x7/8" ponyrod and a 1-1/2" x 26' polish rod. Seat pump and long
stroke it to600# and held OK. Hang well off to pumping unit and return well over to
production. Stay rigged up overnight.

24 Hour Forecast if well is pumping OK on AM of 5/29/08 willRDMO Rocky Mtn WS.

LLTR: 298 bbis

Csg Size: 3-1/2" 9.2# from 4638' to 7000'
5-1/2" 15.5# J-55

Perfs:
OH Iateral from 4750' to7000'
with slotted liner from 4638' to 7000'
Window @4750'

Pump & rods: 2-1/2"x1-3/4"x20x20-1/2x21' RHAC pump (#3023);100 - 3/4" new plain
rods; 82 - 7/8" plain rods; 1 - 4'x7/8" pony rod; 1-1/2" x 26' polish rod

Tbg Detail: Barred NC; 1 jt; SN; 5-1/2" B-2 anchor; 147 jts to surface. Tbg Tail @
4607.6T; SN @4576.08'; B-2 Anchor @4575' w/ a KB detail of 14'. All depths
corrected toKB depths.

Barred NC = 0.44'; 1 jt of tbg = 31.15'; SN = 1.10'; B-2 Anchor = 2.78'; 147 jts of tbg =

4557.20'; Stretch = 1.0'; KB = 14.0'. Tbg tail@4607,6T; SN @4576.08'; Anchor B-2
w/ 12M# tensionat 4574.98'. Alltbg is 2-7/8" EUE 8rd J-55 6.5#.

5/30/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SEQ 2 TIGHT HOLE - Completion of new horizontal Lateral.
Horizontal lateral is in the G-1 Lime.

On 5/29/08 wellis pumping OK. RDMO Rocky Mtn Well Service. Final reportof
lateral completion.

LLTR: 298 bbis

Csg Size: 3-1/2" 9.2# from4638' to 7000'
5-1/2" 15.5# J-55

Perfs:
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Operations Summary Report

Well Name:WV 16G-14-8-21 Spud Date: 3/1/2002
Location: 14- 8-S 21-E 26 Rig Release: 7/31/2003
Rig Name: SEl Rig Number: 3

Date From - To Hours Code e Description of Operations

5/30/2008 06:00 - 16:00 10.00 SEQ 2 OH Iateral from 4750' to 7000'
with slotted liner from 4638' to 7000'
Window @4750'

Pump & rods: 2-1/2"xi-3/4"x20x20-1/2x21' RHAC pump (#3023);100 - 3/4" new plain
rods; 82 -7/8" plain rods; 1 -4'x7/8" pony rod; 1-1/2" x 26' polish rod

Tbg Detail: Barred NC; 1 jt; SN; 5-1/2" B-2 anchor; 147 jts to surface. Tbg Tail @
46076T; SN @4576.08'; B-2 Anchor@4575' w/ a KB detail of 14'. Alldepths
corrected to KB depths.

Barred NC = 0.44'; 1 jt of tbg = 31.15'; SN = 1.10'; B-2 Anchor = 2.78'; 147 jts of tbg =

4557.20'; Stretch = 1.0'; KB = 14.0'. Tbg tail@4607.6T; SN @4576.08'; Anchor B-2
w/ 12M# tension at 4574.98'. Alltbg is 2-7/8" EUE Srd J-55 6.5#.
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g State of Utah

, DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
MICHAEL R. STYLER

JON M.HUNTSMAN, JR. Executive Director

Governor Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
GARY R. HERBERT JOHN R. BAZA
Lieutenant Governor Division Director

February 10, 2009

Laura Bills gy l(pÁg~ Ñ ~

QuestarExploration & Prod. Co. gy ggy g11002 East 17500 South
Vernal, Utah 84078

Re: APDs Rescinded at the request of Questar Exploration & Prod. Co.

Dear Ms. Bills:

Enclosed find the list of APDs that you requested to be rescinded to
QuestarExploration & Production Company. No drilling activity at these
locations has been reported to the division. Therefore, approval to drill these
wells is hereby rescinded, effective February 10, 2009.

A new APD rnust be filed with this office for approval prior to the
commencement of any future work on the subject locations.

If any previously unreported operations have been performed on this well
location, it is imperative that you notify the Division immediately.

Sincerely,

D a Mason
Environmental Scientist

ec: Well File
Bureau of Land Management, Vernal

1594 West North Temple, Suite 1210, PO Box 145801, Salt Lake City, UT 84114-5801
telephone(801) 538-5340 • facsimile{801) 359-3940 • TTY (801) 538-7458 •www.ogm.utah.gov on, as a
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WRU EIH 2AML-35-8-22 43-047-38643
WRU EIH 15AD-35-8-22 43-047-38773
WV l lDML-14-8-21 43-047-38050
WV 4AML-19-8-22 43-047-38051
WRU EIH 6BML-25-8-22 43-047-38650
WRU EIH 10AML-26-8-22 43-047-38647
WRU EIH 14AML-26-8-22 43-047-38648
WRU EIH 8DML-26-8-22 43-047-38638
WRU EIH 9DML-26-8-22 43-047-38639
WRU EIH 15AG-35-8-22 43-047-38772
WV 1DML-13-8-21 43-047-38733
WV 3AML-14-8-21 43-047-38736
WV 4DML-13-8-21



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

Change of Operator (Well Sold) X - Operator Name Change
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/14/2010

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
N5085-QuestarExploration and Production Company N3700-QEP Energy Company

1050 17th St, Suite 500 1050 17th St, Suite 500
Denver, CO 80265 Denver, CO 80265

Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048 Phone: 1 (303) 308-3048

CA No. Unit: WONSITS VALLEY
WELL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL

NO TYPE STATUS
SEE ATTACHED

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/28/2010
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/28/2010
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/24/2010
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 764611-0143
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Requested
5b. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: n/a
5c. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: ok
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM 8/16/2010 BIA not yet
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: 8/16/2010
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: 6/29/2010
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/30/2010
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/30/2010
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/30/2010
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: n/a
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: ESB000024
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 965010693
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 965010695
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: n/a
LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: n/a
COMMENTS:

QEP Enerav (Wnnn¡tm vailm,\ muu a vi- a on



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISIONOF OlL, GAS ANDMINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANOSERIALNUMBER

See attached
6. IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS See attached
7 UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or t° See attacheddrill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATIONFOR PERMITTO DRILLform for such proposals.

1 TYPE OF WELL
8. WELLNAMEand NUMBER:OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER
See attached

2 NAeMEOF o
Xplo tionand Production Company ÁÛ$ Att ch

3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELDANDPOOL, OR WiLDCAT:1050 17th Street, Suite 500 Denver a CO ,,80265 (303) 672-6900 See attached
4 LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGESAT SURFACE: See attached COUNTY: Attached

QTR/QTR. SECTION. TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE
UTAH

n CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONNOTICEOF INTENT
(Subminn Duplicate) ALTERCASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACKTO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work willstart: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

6/14/2010 CHANGETO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBINGREPAIR

O CHANGETUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE
SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELLNAME PLUG BAGK WATER DISPOSAL(Submit Original Form Only)

O CHANGE WELLSTATUS PRODUCTION(STARTIRESUME) WATERSHUT-OFFDate of work completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATIONOF WELLSITE OTHER: Operator Name
O CONVERT WELLTYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENTFORMATION Change

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearty show all pedinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Effective June 14, 2010 Questar Exploration and Production Company changed its name to QEP Energy Company. This namechange involves only an internal corporate name change and no thirdparty change of operator is involved. The sameemployees willcontinue to be responsible for operations of the properties described on the attached list. All operations willcontinue to be covered by bond numbers:
Federal Bond Number: 965002976 (BLM Reference No. ESBOOOO24)
Utah State Bond Number: 965668683
Fee Land Bond Number: M
BIA Bond Number: 799448- Ñ/p Š^Ð/O

(4 /3
The attached document is an all inclusive list of the wells operated by Questar Exploration and Production Company. As ofJune 14, 2010 QEP Energy Company assumes all rights, duties and obligationsas operator of the properties as described onthe list

NAME(PLEASE P Morgan Anderson
TITLE Regulatory Affairs Analyst

SIGNATURg DATE 6/23/2010

(This space for State use only)

RECElVED APPROVED / B0 9
JUN2 8 2010

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side)
ÛÎVÎSÎOR Of Oll,GasandMiningDIV.0FOIL,GAS&MINING Earlene Russell, Engineering



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
WONSITS VALLEY

efectiveJune 14,2010

well_name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
leaseHEV43 11 080S 210E 4304715471 5265 Fedend ONV P

VVV48 10 080S 210E 4304715476 5265 Federed CA¥ P
TVV53 10 080S 210E 4304720003 5265 Federed ()¾7 PTVi?55 14 080S 210E 4304720005 5265 Federal ()VV PW62 10 080S 210E 4304720024 5265 Federal OW P
TVV65 15 080S 210E 4304720041 5265 Federed OVV P
WV 83 WG 23 080S 210E 4304720205 17123 Federal GW P
97V 103 14 080S 210E 4304730021 5265 Federed ONV P
97V 104 15 080S 210E 4304730022 5265 Federed ONV P
97V 105 10 080S 210E 4304730023 5265 Federal ONV P
VVV109 15 080S 210E 4304730045 5265 Federed ONV P
WV 110

17¯080S
210E 4304730046 5265 Federal OW P

NTV 112 15 080S 210E 4304730048 5265 Federed ONV P
VŒV124 15 080S 210E 4304730745 5265 Federed OTV P
TVV128 10 080S 210E 4304730798 5265 Fedehd ONV P9V\r132 15 080S 210E 4304730822 5265 Federal (39V P
97V 136 21 080S 210E 4304731047 5265 Federal ONV S
VVV137 11 080S 210E 4304731523 5265 Federed ONV P
NTV133 15 080S 210E 4304731706 5265 Federed OTV P
TV 144 10 080S 210E 4304731807 5265 Federed ONV P
WV 145 18 080S 220E 4304731820 17123 Federal GW P
VVV121 14 080S 210E 4304731873 5265 Federed ONV T'AYV 135-2 21 080S 210E 4304732016 5265 Federed ONV P
VVV130 22 080S 210E 4304732307 5265 Federed ONV P
VVV119 21 080S 210E 4304732461 5265 Federed ONV PSVV543WG 07 080S 220E 4304732821 17123 Federed GB¥ P
VVi'69 TVGi 18 080S 220E 4304732829 17123 Federal GVV P
VVV38VVGi 08 080S 220E 4304732831 17123 Federal GBW P
WV 49 WG 08 080S 220E 4304732832 17123 Federal GW P
WV 138 WG 18 080S 220E 4304733054 17123 i Federal GW .P
VVV149VGi 12 080S 210E 4304733070 17123 Federed Ciwi P
WV 11 WG 12 080S 210E 4304733085 17123 Federal GW P
VVV819VG 24 080S 210E 4304733086 17123 Federed GNV S
VV 1461¥G 19 080S 220E 4304733128 17123 Federed GINVP
WV lW-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733220 17123 Federal GW P
WV 5W-13- 8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733221 17123 Federal GW ¡PTV37FU469VGi 07 080S 220E 4304733241 17123 Federed GB¥ P
WV 9W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733269 17123 Federal GW P
WV 7W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733270 17123 Federal GW P
WV lW-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733294 17123 Federal GW P
WV 11W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733295 17123 Federal GW P
WV 3W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733493 17123 Federal GW SVVi'59V-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733494 17123 Federal GVV S
WV 11W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733495 17123 Federal GW P
WV 13W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733496 17123 Federal GW P
WV lW-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733501 17123 Federal GW P
WV 3W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733502 17123 Federal GW P
WV 7WRG-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733503 5265 Federal OW P
TVi' 165V-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733529 17123 Federal (39V P

Bonds:BLM= ESBOOOO24
BIA=956010693

State= 965010695 1 of



Questar ExplorationProduction Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
WONSITS VALLEY

efectiveJune 14,2010

well_name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
leaseWV lW-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733531 17123 Federal GW S

TV3719V-13-8-21 13 080S 210·E 4304733532 17123 Federal (JVV SVV3739V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733533 17123 Federal (39V PWV 9W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733534 17123 Federal GW P
TV\T llyV-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733535 17123 Federal (ITV PVVil119V-13-8-21 13 080S 2101E4304733536 17123 Federal (39V PVVi'139V-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733537 17123 Federal (39V SVVif139V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733538 17123 Federal (39V PWV 16G-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733565 5265 Federal OW PVVit1\V-21-8-:21 21 080S 210E 4304733602 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 3W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733603 17123 Federal GW SWV 3W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733604 17123 Federal GWVVi'39V-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304733605 17123 Federal GNV PVVir139V-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733607 17123 Federal (39V PTVit 15V-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304733613 17123 Federal GVV P
yV_ 11_W 8-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733626

_

17123 Federal GW PVV\729V-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733655 17123 Federal GVV PVV\'49V-ll-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733657 17123 Federal (ITV P
VV37129V-10-8-21 10 080S 210·E 4304733659 17123 Federal (ITV SWV 12G-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733660 5265 Federal OW P
TV\' 159V-9-8-:21 09 080S 210E 4304733661 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 15G-9-8-21 09 080S 210E 4304733662 5265 Federal lOWVV\'21V-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733791 17123 Federal GYVTV3/69V-13-8-21 13 080S 210·E 4304733792 17123 Federal (19V PVV\/89V-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733793 17123 Federal GVV P
WV 10W-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304733794 17123 Federal GW TATV3710TV-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733795 17123 Federal (19V PVVV12\V-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733808 17123 Federal GA¥ PVV3769V-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733811 17123 Federal 439V P
\Y3779V-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733812 17123 Federal (19V P
NY'l 10TV-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733813 17123 Federal (39V PTV37129V-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304733815 17123 Federal GNV P
TV37149V-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733816 17123 Federal (19V P
TVi' 169V-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733817 17123 Federal GVV P
WV 6W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304733828 17123 Federal GW P
WV 6W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733842 17123 Federal GW P
WV 6WC-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733843 17123 Federal GW P
WV 6WD-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733844 17123 Federal GW PTV3759V-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733860 17123 Federal (39V PgrVTW'-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304733861 17123 Federed GAV P
TV3/89V-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733862 17123 Federal (39V P
TVV 10\V-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733863 17123 Federal GVV PTVi7149V-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304733864 17123 Federal GVV P
WV 16W-12-8-21 12 080$ 210E 4304733865 17123 Federal GW PTV3719¥-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733902 17123 Federal (19V STVi/13¥-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304733903 17123 Federed Cin' S
NV\T INV-23-8-:21 23 080S 210E 4304733904 17123 Federal (39V DP
WV 6W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733906 17123 Federal GW PTVi/79V-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304733908 17123 Federal 939V IP

Bonds:BLhn = EfsBOOOO24
BIA=956010693

S:tate = 965010695 2 of



Questar Exploration Production Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
WONSITSVALLEY

e#ectiveJune 14,2010

well name see twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

TVV10NV-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733910 17123 Federal G'ñW P
TV\' 119V-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733911 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 13W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733913 17123 Federal GW SVVir139V-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733914 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 15W-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304733916 17123 Federal GW PVVil 159V-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733917 17123 Federal (39V PVVir59V-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733953 17123 Federal GVV PTV3775V-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733955 17123 Federal (19V P
VVV89V-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304733957 _ 17123 Federal GYV SVV3789V-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733958 | 17123 Federal (39V PVViT99V-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304733959 | 17123 Federal GYV P
TV31129V-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733961 17123 Federal (39V PVV37149V-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304733962 17123 Federal (INV P
TV37159V-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304733963 17123 Federal (39V PVVi'29V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733986 17123 Federal GNV PTVV89V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733989 17123 Federal GB¥ P
VV3710TV-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733991 17123 Iù>deral (ITV P
WV 12W-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733993 17123 Federal GW S\Y,7 149V-18-8-22 18 080S 220E 4304733995 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 8W-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734009 17123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 4W-17-8-22

_

17 WOS 220E 4304734038 17123 Federal GW P
WV 12G-1-8-21 01 080S 210E 4304734108 5265 Federal OW TA
SV3/29V-14-8-21 14 080S 210·E 4304734140 17123 Federal (39V P
GH 2W-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734141 17123 Federal GW P
TVV2NV-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734142 17123 Fedeñd GA¥ P
VVV31V-21-8-:21 21 080S 210E 4304734143 17123 Fedeñd G'A¥ P
WV 4W-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304734144 17123 Federal GW PTV\'49V-21-8-21 21 080S 210E 4304734145 17123 Federal GNV P
TVV49V-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734146 17123 Federal (19V P
WV 16W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734155 5265 Federal GW P
TV'l 39V-19-8-22 19 080S 220E 4304734187 17123 Federal (39V P
TVi'41V-23-8-:21 23 080S 210E 4304734188 17123 Fedend GA¥ P
WV 6W-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734189 17123 Federal GW S
TV\T2NV-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734242 17123 Federal GVV PVV\725V-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734243 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 4W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734244 17123 Federal GW S
WV 6W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734245 5265 Federal GW TA
pç\r79V-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734246 17123 Federal (39V P
WV 8W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734247 17123 Federal GW PVV\'129V-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734248 17123 Federal GVV Trt
WV 14W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734249 17123 Federal GW PTVir 169V-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304734250 17123 Federal GNV P
WV 16W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734251 17123 Federal GW P
WV 3W-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734267 123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 4D-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304734268 17123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 6W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734271 17123 Federal GW S
WV 9W-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734274 17123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 10W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734275 17123 Federal GW P
WV 11W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734277 17123 Federal GW P

Bonds:BLhn = EISBOOOO24
BIA=956010693

S:tate = 965010695 3 of



Questar ExplorationProduction Company (N5085) to QEP Energy Company (N3700)
WONSITS VALLEY

effective June 14, 2010

well name sec twp rng api entity mineral type stat C
lease

WV 12W-14-8-2I 14 080S 210E 4304734279 17123 Federal GW TA
WV 14M-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304734280 17123 Federal GW P
WV 14W-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734281 17123 Federal GW S
WV 16G-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304734283 5265 Federal OW P
WV 3MU-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734289 17123 Federal GW P
WV 4MU-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734291 17123 Federal GW P
WV 5MU-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734293 17123 Federal GW P
WV 6W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734294 17123 Federal GW P
WV 10W-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304734295 17123 Federal GW P
WV 4W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734330 17123 Federal GW P
WV 8M-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304734339 17123 Federal GW P
WV 8W-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304734340 17123 Federal GW P
WV 2W-8-8-22 08 080S 220E 4304734468 17123 Federal GW P
WV 8W-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304734469 17123 Federal GW S
WV 8W-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304734564 17123 Federal GW JP
WV 14MU-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304735879 17123 Federal GW P
WV 13MU-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304736305 17123 Federal GW P
WV 3D-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304737923 17123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 14DML-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304737924 17123 Federal GW P
WV 15AML-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304737925 17123 Federal GW OPS C
WV 13DML-10-8-21 10 080S 210E 4304737926 17123 Federal GW P
WV 4DML-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304737927 17123 Federal GW P
WV 11AD-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304738049 17123 Federal GW P
WV 6-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304738663 17123 Federal GW P
WV 2ML-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304738664 Federal GW APD C
WV 16C-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304738737 17123 Federal GW P
WV 7BML-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304738970 Federal GW APD C
WV 7AML-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304739035 Federal GW APD C
WV 14BML-12-8-21 12 080S 210E 4304739036 Federal GW APD C
WV 14B-13-8-21 13 080S 210E 4304739037 Federal GW APD C
WV 4B-14-8-21 14 080S 210E 4304739038 Federal GW APD C
WV 13A-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304739039 17123 Federal GW P
WV 8D-15-8-21 15 080S 210E 4304739040 17123 Federal GW P
WV 4BD-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304739041 17123 Federal GW P
WV 7CML-11-8-21 11 080S 210E 4304739042 Federal GW APD C
WV 7BD-23-8-21 23 080S 210E 4304739044 17123 Federal GW P
WV 2CML-7-8-22 07 080S 220E 4304739155 Federal GW APD C
WV 13AD-8-8-22R(RIGSKID) 08 080S 220E 4304739321 17123 Federal GW P
WV 2B-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304740262 Federal GW APD C
WV 8D-22-8-21 22 080S 210E 4304740263 Federal GW APD C
WV 7A-24-8-21 24 080S 210E 4304740331 Federal GW APD C

Bonds: BLM = ESBOOOO24
BIA= 956010693

State = 965010695 4 of



United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
TAKE PRioE'+4NCH p/ Utah State Office NAM ER ICA

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155

http://www.blm.gov/ut/st/en.html

IN REPLY REFER TO:
3100
(UT-922)

JUL 2 8 2010

Memorandum

Fr m:

1FrieldhOfEce,Price Fie ce Mo Fi

Subject: Name Change Recognized

Attached is a copy of the Certificate of Name Change issued by the Texas Secretary of State and
a decision letter recognizing the name change from the Eastern States Office. We have updated
our records to reflect the name change in the attached list of leases.

The name change from QuestarExploration and Production Company into QEP Energy
Company is effective June 8, 2010.

cc: MMS
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